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Form 3160-3
(August 1999)

UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER

FORM APPROVED
OMB No. 1004-0136
Expires November 30, 2000

5. Lease Serial No.

UTU 0806

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
UTE TRIBAL

la. Type of Work:  §§ DRILL O REENTER

1b. Type of Well: 0 0il well R Gas Well

O Other

CONFIDENTIAL

R Single Zone O Muitiple Zone

7. If Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.
WONSITS VALLEY

8. Lease Name and Well No.
WONSITS VALLEY 3W-12-8-21

2. Name of Operator
SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC.

Contact: JOHN BUSCH

E-Mail: jbusch@shenandoahenergy.com

VS 0473 Y7

3a. Address
11002 E. 17500 S.
VERNAL, UT 84078

3b. Phone No. (include area code)
Ph: 435.781.4341 Fx: 435.781.4323

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
WONSITS VALLEY

4. Location of Well

(Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*)

Yy % N

11. Sec., T., R., M., or BIk. and Survey or Area

At surface NENW 788FNL 1941FWL c Sec 12 T8S R21E Mer SLB
At proposed prod. zone é ? 727 5
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State
15 MILES SOUTHWEST OF REDWASH UTAH UINTAH ut
15. Distance from proposed location to nearest property or 16. No. of Acres in Lease 17. Spacing Unit dedicated to this well
lease line, ft. (Also to nearest drig. unit line, if any)
788 2480.00 40.00

18. Distance from proposed location to nearest well, drilling,
completed, applied for, on this lease, ft.

19. Proposed Depth

20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file

1500 7890 MD U-0969
7890 TVD
21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KB, RT, GL, etc. 22. Approximate date work will start 23. Estimated duration
4977 KB 08/24/2001 10 DAYS

24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor.

4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see

2. A Drilling Plan. Item 20 above).
3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the 5. Operator certification .
SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office). 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the
authorized officer.
25. Signature Name (Printed/Typed) Date
l ) - JOHN BUSCH 08/24/2001
Title
\ OPERATIONS
oS0\
Name (Printed/Typed) Date
Y -
BRADLEY G Hil | L5 -8

Officc RECLAMATION SPECIALIST 1li

Application approval does fot warrant or certify the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct

operations thereon.
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

Additional Operator Remarks (see next page)

Electronic Submission #6303 verified by the BLM Well Information System
For SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC., sent to the Vernal
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T8S, RZfE', S.L.B.&M. SHENANDOAH ENERGY, INC.

Well location, WV #3W-12-8-21
7.95'0 Bross Cop

, located as

0 Set Stone,
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~
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BASIS OF ELEVATION

BENCH MARK (45 EAM) LOCATED IN THE N 1/2 OF SECTION
5, T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE BRENNAN BASIN
QUADRANGLE, UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY 7.5 MINUTE QUAD.
(TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL SURVEY. SAID
ELEVATION IS MARKED AS BEING 4689 FEET.

ToaT WV #3wW—-12-8-21
\ Elev. Ungraded Ground = 4969’

NO135'58"W — 2704.43° (Meas.)
NOO46'12°W — 2714.78" (Meas.)
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Additional Operator Remarks:

Shenandoah Energy Inc. proposes to drill a well to 7890 to test the Wasatch. If productive, casing
will be run and the well completed. If dry, the well will be plugged and abandoned as per BLM and State
of Utah requirements.

Operation will be according to the Standard Operating Practices for Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum
Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and undesignated fields in T7S, R21-24E and T8S, R21-24E.

See Onshore Order No. 1 attached.

Please be advised that Shenandoah Energy Inc. is considered to be the operator of the above mentioned
well. Shenandoah Energy Inc. agrees to be responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease for
the operations conducted upon the lease lands.

Bond coverage for this well is provided by bond No. U-0969. The principal is Shenandoah Energy Inc. via
surety as consent as provided for in 43 CFR 3104.2.



SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC.
WELL # WV 3W-12-8-21

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore
Federal Qil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made
with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas No. 1, and the approved
plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy
of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

1.

Formation Tops

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth Prod. Phase Anticipated
Uinta Surface

Green River 2842

Mahogany Ledge 3617

Wasatch 6182'

TD (Wasatch) 7890' Gas

Anticipated Depths of Qil, Gas, Water and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas or other
mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance - Formation Depth
Oil/Gas Wasatch 7890'

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling, will be
recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested to
determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal, Utah.

Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If no flows are detected,
samples will be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses conducted.

Anticipated Bottom Hole Pressures

Maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure equals approximately 3156.0 psi.



SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC.
WONSITS VALLEY UNIT #3W-12-8-21
788' FNL 1941° FWL NENW
SECTION 12, T8S, R21E, SLB&M
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
LEASE # UTU-0806

ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1
MULTI - POINT SURFACE USE & OPERATIONS PLAN
Existing Roads:
Refer to Topo Maps A and B for location of access roads within a 2 — mile radius.

There will be no improvements made to existing access roads.

Planned Access Roads:

Please see the Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in T7S, R21-24E and T8S, R21-24E Standard Operating Practices (SOP).

Refer to Topo Map B for the location of the proposed access road.

Location of Existing Wells Within a 1 —~ Mile Radius:

Please refer to Topo Map C.
Location of Existing & Proposed Facilities:

Please see the Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in T7S, R21-24E and T8S, R21-24E Standard Operating Practices (SOP).

Refer to Topo Map D for the location of the proposed pipeline.

Location and Type of Water Supply:

Please see the Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in T7S, R21-24E and T8S, R21-24E Standard Operating Practices (SOP).

Source of Construction Materials:

Please see the Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in T7S, R21-24E and T8S, R21-24E Standard Operating Practices (SOP).

Methods of Handling Waste Materials:

Please see the Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in T7S, R21-24E and T8S, R21-24E Standard Operating Practices (SOP).



10.

1.

12,

Ancillary Facilities:

Please see the Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in T7S, R21-24E and T8S, R21-24E Standard Operating Practices (SOP).

Well Site Layout: (See Location Layout Diagram)

The attached Location Layout Diagram describes drill pad cross-sections, cuts and fills and locations
of the mud tanks, reserve pit, flare pit, pipe racks, trailer parking, spoil dirt stockpile(s), and surface
material stockpile(s).

Please see the attached diagram to describe rig orientation, parking areas, and access roads.

Plans for Reclamation of the Surface:

Please see the Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in T7S, R21-24E and T8S, R21-24E Standard Operating Practices (SOP).

Surface Ownership:

The well pad and access road are located on lands owned by:
Ute Indian Tribe

P.O. Box 143

Ft. Duchesne, UT 84026

Other Information

A Class lil archaeological survey was conducted by Montgomery Archaeology Consultants. A copy
of this report was submitted directly to the appropriate agencies by Montgomery Archaeology
Consultants. Cultural resource clearance was recommended for this location.



Lessee’s or Operator’s Representative:

John Busch
Red Wash Operations Rep.
Shenandoah Energy Inc.
11002 East 17500 South
Vernal, Utah 84078
(435) 781-4341

Certification:

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made
with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil & Gas Orders, the approved plan of operations,
and any applicable Notice to Lessees.

Shenandoah Energy Inc. will be fully responsible for the actions of their subcontractors.

A complete copy of the approved Application for Permit to Drill will be furnished to the field
representative(s) to ensure compliance and shall be on location during all construction and
drilling operations.

| hereby certify that 1, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the proposed drill
site and access route; that | am familiar with the conditions which currently exist; that the
statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and correct; and that the
work associated with the operations proposed herein will be performed by Shenandoah Energy
Inc. its’ contractors and subcontractors in conformity with this plan and the terms and Conditions
under which it is approved. This statement is subject to the provisions of 18 U.S.C. 1001 for

the filing of a false statement.

/44)? 22-0/

John Busch Date
Red Wash Operations Representative
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SHENANDOAH ENERGY, INC.

LOCATION LAYOUT FOR

WV #3W—12-8-21
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SHENANDOAH ENERGY, INC. I FICURE 32]
TYPICAL CROSS SECTIONS FOR ' '
WV #3W—12-8-21
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85 So. 200 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (435) 789-1017




44

7
&

gz ~ATANY. RIR ; o
e LT
)AL L EJE § ) ; |
o 7{‘_ Al O T

T . 1 1 A 36
v vimizea [ Yod (1 el

157

)
"N
N
SY
N

~

e
X

¥
i P

SEE TOPO "B”

7 {
J\
[) ‘\ﬁt'%% b

v'\/
¥

Y

NS
= 0.9 Mi. +i-J/4

L &7 ; ; ’ 0 qh.\ ¢ !
LEGEND: N SHENANDOAH ENERGY, INC.

WV #3W-12-8-21
SECTION 12, T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M.
788' FNL 1941' FWL

8Ti3[01

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGRAPHIC

85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 M A P MONTH| A

(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813 - -
IS SCALE: 1:100,000 | DRAWN BY: K.G. [REVISED: 00-00-00| [ €3 e}

(® PROPOSED LOCATION




4

LE

2

L3

E'PROPOSED ACC
g g

GEND:

SHENANDOAH ENERGY, INC.

PROPOSED ACCESS ROAD N

EXISTING ROAD

WV #3W-12-8-21

SECTION 12, T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M.

788' FNL 1941' FWL

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying
8S South 200 East Vernal, Utah 34078
(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813

SCALE: 1"=2000"

DRAWN BY: K.G. JREVISED: 00-00-00

CONFIDENTIAL



PROPOSED LOCA TION:
WV #3W-12-8-21

LEGEND: SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC
& DISPOSAL WELLS 2" WATER WELLS N WV #3W-12-8-21

@ PRODUCING WELLS -¢. ABANDONED WELLS SECTION 12, T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M.
¢ SHUT IN WELLS -@- TEMPORARILY ABANDONED 788' FNL 1941' FWL

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying

8S South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078
(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
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SHENANDOAH ENERGY, INC.

WV #3W-

12-8-21

LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

SECTION 12, T8S,

PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #1 TO LOCATION STAKE

R21E, S.L.B.&M.

[LOCATION STAKE]

PHOTO: VIEW FROM BEGINNING OF PROPOSED ACCESS

l —  Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying

S 85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078
- Since 1964 - 435-789-1017  uels@uelsinc.com

CAMERA ANGLE: WESTERLY

LOCATION PHOTOS

8

MONTH

15

01
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[ TAKEN BY. DA. | DRAWN BY. K.G. JREVISED: 00-00-00




WORKSHEET

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 08/29/2001

WELL NAME: WV 3w-12-8-21
OPERATOR : SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC ( N4235 )
CONTACT: JOHN BUSCH

PROPOSED LOCATION:

API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-34267

PHONE NUMBER: 435-781-4341

INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
NENW 12 080s 210E
BOTTOM: 0788 FNL 1941 FWL . .
Engineering
UINTAH
WONSITS VALLEY ( 710 ) Geology
1 - Fed 1 Surface
LEASE TYPE: eaera
LEASE NUMBER: UTU-0806
SURFACE OWNER: 2 - Indian
PROPOSED FORMATION: WSTC
RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:
v/“. Plat R649-2-3. Unit WONSITS VALLEY
. Bond: Fed[1l] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[] R649-3-2. General
(No. U-0969 ) Siting: 460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells
_Ji__ Potash (Y/N) R649-3-3. Exception
-0il Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 V///
Water Permit — Y Drilling Unit
(No. 43-8496 ) Board Cause No: /217,0/,
N RDCC Review (Y/N) Eff Date: -2 2001
Siting: A .
(Date: ) ’
Hlﬂ Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENT'S :

wV pAfLJ Shfz SﬁfﬁJQj; JQZL—

STIPULATIONS:

l’/:(:/ &Iﬂr\// .




OPERATOR: SHENANDOAH ENERGY (N4235)
SEC. 11,12 & 14, T8S, R21E
FIELD: WONSITS VALLEY (710)

COUNTY: UINTAH UNIT: WONSITS VALLEY
CAUSE: 187-06

Utah Oil Gas and Mining

FBSRME::-:1itcl it T RS B S i

. ® _
WAFU #W-11-8-21 e ey 2 winz w%s
" & Wvu 30
Wvu 20 : : e “@;2*23 e WVFU 1W-12-8-24
WVFU 4G-11:8-21 ey WV IW:11:8-21 R Wy Wi a T
WONSITSVALLEY FIELD
WVFU 8W-11-8-21 | WV 11
L 1 WVU 88 WV 85
s FRE e Yol WVFU BW-11-8-21 MWE ? [C:) >
WVU 34 WV 137 -39 WVFU 11 WG
® ; Wirses |© wy sw-t2-821 wv.aw-12-8-21 PG WVFU BW-12-8-21
WV 5W-11-8-21 WV TW-11-8-21 {
| 12
" '
| a
: | W88 WVFU 1IW:12:8-21 (‘SW“ PAVFUIW- 12831
wvu 87 ; o4 RURES : "o ¥
- Wi 28 w ® ; | w@:w-izu1 _ wvu 10 WVFU 10W-12-8:21 i
WV AZWI8-21. . Wvy 282 WIWY) - WVFUL10W-11-8-21 FASIIRRSII :
WY 11 18:21 St . 'WONSITS VALLEY UNIT
i - CAUSE 187-06 (8-2-2001)
. WV 17 Wwvu 82 WVl 14 WVU 108
WU 88 : : iy
. @ ngﬁ WV@'-’-?S vauﬁzw_‘u_z‘ w(?'ruuw AR WWFUIAWG ey sew-12.8:21 |
® WV 43 WY 1AW 11,821 WV 1SW-11821 | WV 16W-118:21 ' : ; :
WVU 116 St I L SR R g e S RO T P
"t A A - e e g S
WVFU 3W-14-8-21 - ‘ W\:J 101 wwzs M:N-1m1 WU 52
WV 102 s ; o8
wwy 103 Y. S0 e w2 @ WVED SWL(3:831, - - iy igd WAFU 1W-138.21
® o Wy 31 WV 2W-1a-8:21" { WV 4W.13.8:21
" i wv‘w-“,.g.z{ : WVFU 1W-14-8- 21 | . . .
! relias ;
: | : Nav
LB WVFU BW-14-8:21 - | e "f:"?’ oh “;\_N_'Dﬁ : it WVU 118
®a il WiALSS . ® | WVU 47 WIFL) BW-13-821 W
& | WVFU TWH3621 1 o
wwise ® ® WVU 111 = o pETTE ’
W éw-14.21 WVFL TW:14-8-21 s
@ WY iZwesZ) " : :
«® fritise : TR WVEU 6W-13-8:21
VU 107 WVFU 11W- WU 113
S WW 35 wisds oo f i YR Niv-indat s . :
Wvi iga pA 2 _ i b4
)f( WV 10W,14-8-21 | wvruv*w-u@_zr L W szwea 21 w1uw-1m1 WVUT8
WV 1IW-14-821 : : i
? ; Wvey 10 WVFU 16W-13-8-21
C WY 14W-148-21 oAl WV 18W-14-8-21 wss Wit WVFU 70 WG o
. ® WVU'B5° ; o (O @® ®
WURL taw 3iead °® WVFUWASEZT | vy faw-1s-a21 WVFU 15W-13-8-21

WVFU 15W-14-8-21

WVEU 1W,24.8-21
']

PREPARED BY: LCORDOVA
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United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT .
Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3160
(UT-922)
September 5, 2001
Memorandum
To: Assistant District Manager Minerals, Vernal District
From: Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer
Subject: 2001 Plan of Development Wonsits Valley Unit,

Pursuant to email between Lisha Cordova,

Uintah County, Utah.

Mining, and Mickey Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land
Management. The following wells are planned for calendar year
2001 within the Wonsits Valley Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

Api Number
(Proposed PZ

43-047-34263
43-047-34264
43-047-34265
43-047-34266
43-047-34267
43-047-34268
43-047-34269
43-047-34270
43-047-34271
43-047-34273
43-047-34274
43-047-34275
43-047-34276
43-047-34277
43-047-34278
43-047-34279
43-047-34280
43-047-34281
43-047-34282
43-047-34283

Well Location

Wasatch)

WV 1w-11-8-21 Sec. 11, T8S, R21E 0699 FNL 0615 FEL
WV 2wW-11-8-21 Sec. 11, T8S, R21E 0791 FNL 1996 FEL
WV 2wW-12-8-21 Sec. 12, T8S, R21E (0948 FNL 1818 FEL
WV 3w-11-8-21 Sec. 11, T8S, R21E 0440 FNL 1946 FWL
WV 3W-12-8-21 Sec. 12, T8S, R21E 0788 FNL 1941 FWL
WV 4w-12-8-21 Sec. 12, T8S, R21E 0356 FNL 0475 FWL
WV 5W-11-8-21 Sec. 11, T8S, R21E 2109 FNL 0676 FWL
WV 5wW-12-8-21 Sec. 12, T8S, R21E 2167 FNL 0586 FWL
WV 6W-14-8-21 Sec. 14, T8S, R21E 2194 FNL 2012 FWL
WV 7W-11-8-21 Sec. 11, T8S, R21E 2094 FNL 2092 FEL
WV 9w-11-8-21 Sec. 11, T8S, R21E 1921 FSL 0758 FEL
WV 10W-14-8-21 Sec. 14, T8S, R21E 1787 FSL 2028 FEL
WV 11W-11-8-21 Sec. 11, T8S, R21E 1911 FSL 2075 FWL
WV 11W-14-8-21 Sec. 14, T8S, R21E 1690 FSL 2145 FWL
WV 12W-11-8-21 Sec. 11, T8S, R21E 1919 FSL 0917 FWL
WV 12W-14-8-21 Sec. 14, T8S, R21E 2341 FSL 0841 FWL
WV 14W-11-8-21 Sec. 11, T8S, R21E 0657 FSL 2058 FWL
WV 14W-14-8-21 Sec. 14, T8S, R21E 0662 FSL 2002 FWL
WV 15W-11-8-21 Sec. 11, T8S, R21E 0607 FSL 1933 FEL
WV 16W-14-8-21 Sec. 14, T8S, R21E 0684 FSL 0537 FEL

This office has no objection to permitting the wells at this

time.

/s/ Michael L. Coulthard

bcec: File - Wonsits Valley Unit
Division of 0il Gas and Mining

Agr.

Sec. Chron

Division of 0il, Gas and



DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Governor PO Box 145801
Kathleen Clarke Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801
Executive Director § 801-538-5340
Lowell P. Braxton || 801-359-3940 (Fax)
Division Director & 801-538-7223 (TDD)

@ Statdof Utah ®

Michael O. Leavitt

September 5, 2001

Shenandoah Energy Inc.
11002 East 17500 South
Vernal, UT 84078

Re:  Wonsits Valley 3W-12-8-21 Well, 788 FNL, 1941' FWL, NE NW, Sec. 12, T. 8 South,
R. 21 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et seq., Utah
Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous
operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date. The API
identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-34267.

S' 2@%

John R. Baza
ssociate Director

dm
Enclosures
cc:  Uintah County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office



Operator: Shenandoah Energy Inc.

Well Name & Number Wonsits Valley 3W-12-8-21

API Number: 43-047-34267

Lease: UTU 0806

Location: NE NW Sec. 12 T. 8 South R. 21 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements

Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
. Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
. Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements

All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be

obtained prior to drilling.



Form 3160-3 l
(August 1999)

UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER

FORM APPROVED
OMB No. 1004-0136
Expires November 30, 2000

5. Lease Serial No.
UTU 0806

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
UTE TRIBAL

1a. Type of Work: B DRILL [0 REENTER 7. If Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.
CONFIDENTIAL WONSITS VALLEY
8. Lease Name and Well No.

1b. Type of Well: [ Oil Weil 8 Gas Well [ Other & Single Zone ] Multiple Zone WONSITS VALLEY 3W-12-8-21
2. Name of Contact: JOHN BUSCH 9. API Well No.

SHENA DOAH ENERGY INC. E-Mail: jbusch@shenandoahenergy.com
3a. 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

11002 E. 17500 S. Ph: 435.781.4341 Fx: 435.781.4323 WONSITS VALLE

VERNAL, UT 84078

4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any Wq@@k‘{/ E D

11. Sec., T.,R., M., or BIk. and Survey or Area

At surface NENW 788FNL 1941FWL | Sec 12 T8S R21E Mer SLB
SEP-11 2001
At proposed prod. zone
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or st office* 12. County or Parish 13. State
'15 MILES SOUTHWEST OF REDWASH UINTAH : uT
15. Distance from proposed location to nearest property or 16. No. of Acres in Lease 17. Spacing Unit dedicated to this well
Jease line, ft. (Also to nearest drig. unit line, if any)
788 2480.00 40.00
18. Distance from proposed location to nearest well, drilling, | 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file
completed, applied for, on this lease, fi.
1500 7890 MD U-0969
7890 TVD
21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KB, RT, GL, etc. 22. Approximate date work will start 23, Estimated duration
4977 KB 08/24/2001 10 DAYS

24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore 0Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1 Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see
. A Drilling Plan. Item 20 above).
. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the 5. Operator certification
SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office). 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the
authorized officer.
25. Signature Name (Printed/Typed) Date
JOHN BUSCH 08/24/2001
OPERATIONS
by (Snym Name (Ln‘gd/Typed) — Date
%’: Ly L Fozsmn (1051
Tlﬂe e et ER4 180 lukq S Ofﬂce
ALTING wnn:‘r | Resoues

Application approval does not warrant or certify the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease whlch would entitle the applicant to conduct

operations thereon. NOTQ@E 9 *;J"?QOVAL

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and wi ilifully to make to any dcpartment T agcncy of thc Umted
States any false, ﬁctmous or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction. i i :

Additional Operator Remarks (see next page)

Electronic Submission #6303 verified by the BLM Well iInformation System
For SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC., sent to the Vernal
Committed to AFMSS for processing by LESLIE CRINKLAW on 09/11/2004; ()

CONDITIONS OF APPR JOVAL ATTACHED

* ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ™ ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ™

O/ IILF NO Aos



COAs Page 1 of 4
Well No.: WVFU 3W-12-8-21

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company/Operator: _Shenandoah Energy Inc.

Well Name & Number: WVFU #3W-12-8-21

API Number: 43-047-34267

Lease Number: __U- 0806

Location: NENW_ Sec. 12 T.8S R.21E

Agreement: Wonsits Valley Unit

For more specific details on notification requirements, please check the Conditions of Approval
for Notice to Drill and Surface Use Program. ‘

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

,Approv'al of this application does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable
title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations

thereon.

Be aware fire restrictions may be in effect when location is being constructed and/or when well
is being drilled. Contact the appropriate Surface Management Agency for information.

DRILLING PROGRAM

The base of the usable water zone identified at 2149'. To protect this resource, the
cement behind the production casing must extend a minimum of 200" above this point.

Coring. Logaing and Testing Program

Daily drilling and completion progress reports shall be submitted to this office on a
weekly basis.



COAs Page 2 of 4
Well No.: WVFU 3W-12-8-21

Other Information

In the event after-hours approvals are necessary, you must contact one of the following
individuals:

Ed Forsman (435) 828-7874
Petroleum Engineer

Kirk Fleetwood (435) 828-7875
Petroleum Engineer

BLM FAX Machine  (435) 781-4410



® ° ,
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Well No.: WVFU 3W-12-8-21

SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

Shenandoah Energy, INC. (Shenandoah) will assure the Ute Tribe that any/all contractors and
subcontractors have acquired a current Tribal Business License and have updated “Access
Permits” prior to construction. All Shenandoah personnel, contractors and subcontractors will
have these permits in their vehicles at all times. Companies that have not complied with this
COA will be in violation of the Ute Tribal Business License Ordinance, and will be subject to
fines and penalties.

Shenandoah employees, representatives, and/or authorized 'personnel (subcontractors) shall
not carry firearms on their person or in their vehicles while working on the Uintah and Ouray

Indian Reservation. _

Shenandoah employees and/or authorized personnel (subcontractors) in the field will have
approved applicable APDs and/or ROW permits/authorizations on their person(s) during all
phases of construction.

Shenandoah will notify the Ute Tribe and Bureau of Indian Affairs (BIA) in writing of any
requested modification of APDs or Rights-Of Way (ROW). Shenandoah shall receive written
notification of authorization or denial of the requested modification. Without authorization,
Shenandoah will be subject to fines and penalties.

The Ute Tribe Energy & Minerals Department shall be notified in writing 48 hours in advance of
any construction activity. The Ute Tribal office is open Monday through Thursday. A Tribal
Technician is to routinely monitor construction. Shenandoah shall make arrangements with the
Ute Energy & Minerals Department for all monitoring that will exceed regular working hours for
Tribal Technicians. A qualified Archaeologist accompanied by a Tribal Technician will
monitor any trenching required for the construction of the pipeline in the ROW corridor.
Shenandoah is to inform contractors to maintain construction of the pipelines within the
approved right of ways.

Shenandoah shall maintain cattleguards and fence integrity as originally constructed for any
access roads or pipeline routes which cross the Ute Indian Reservation Boundary Fence.

A corridor ROW, 30 feet wide and 1640 feet long, shall be granted for the pipeline. About 44
feet of new access road ROW, 30 feet wide, will be needed to reach the location from existing
roads. The new access road and the pipeline do not coincide. Upon authorization by the Ute
Tribe Energy & Minerals Department, the ROW may be wider where sharp curves; deep cuts
and fills occur: or, where intersections with other roads are required.

Upon completion of the pertinent APD and ROWs, Shenandoah will notify the Ute Tribe Energy
& Minerals Department for a Tribal Technician to verify the Affidavit of Completion. When each
pipeline has been constructed and completed as built descriptions will be filed with the Ute
Tribal Energy and Minerals Department.



® e
COAs Page 4 of 4

Well No.: WVFU 3W-12-8-21

Production waters, oil, and other byproducts shall not be placed on access roads or the well
pad.

All vehicular traffic, personnel movement, construction and restoration operations will be
confined to the areas examined and approved and to the existing roadways and/or evaluated

access routes.
Shenandoah will implement “Safety and Emergency Plan” and ensure plan compliance.

Shenandoah shall stop construction activities and notify personnel from the Ute Tribe Energy &
Minerals Department and BIA if cultural remains including paleontologic resources (vertebrate
fossils) are exposed or identified during construction. The Ute Tribe Department of Cultural
Rights and Protection and the BIA will provide mitigation measures prior to allowing
construction.

Shenandoah employees and/or authorized personnel (subcontractors) will not be allowed to
collect artifacts and paleontologic fossils. No significant cultural resources shall be disturbed.

Shenandoah will control noxious weeds on the well site and ROWs. Shenandoah will be
responsible for noxious weed control if weeds spread from the project area onto adjoining land.

Reserve pits will be lined with an impervious synthetic liner. A fence will be constructed around
the reserve pit until it is backfilled. Prior to backfilling the reserve pit, all fluids will be pumped
from the pit into trucks and hauled to approved disposal sites. When the reserve pits are
backfilled, the surplus oil and mud, etc., will be buried a minimum of 3 feet below the surface of

the soil.

A closed system will be used during production. This means that production fluids will be
contained in leak-proof tanks. All production fluids will be disposed of at approved disposal

sites.

Surface pipelines will be constructed to lay on the soil surface. The ROW will not be bladed or
cleared of vegetation without authorization of the BIA. Surface pipelines shall be welded in
place at well sites or on access roads and on other existing roads then pulled into place with
suitable equipment. Vehicles shall not use pipeline ROWSs as access roads unless specifically
authorized.

Before the site is abandoned, Shenandoah will be required to restore the well site and ROWs to
near their original state. The disturbed areas will be reseeded with desirable perennial
vegetation.

Soil erosion will be mitigated by reseeding all disturbed areas.



Form 3160-5 :
August 1999 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(huge ) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR B OME JO. 1%04-% 3000
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Xpies: Jovemper>,
5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-0806
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an & T indian AT Trbe N
abandoned well. Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. . U'IPEla'IPF’QIBEnee or 1ribe Name

- i i H 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other lnstruc{l?qf ‘op-f?vgrse side. WONSITS VALLEY

i 4 e g

1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.
0 Oil Well (@ Gas Well [ Other WONSITS VALLEY 3W-12-8-21

wwd b LG

2. Name of Operator Contact: RALEEN SEARLE 9. API Well No.

SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC. E-Mail: rsearle@shenandoahenergy.com 43-047-34267

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH Ph: 435.781.4309 WONSITS VALLEY
VERNAL, UT 84078 Fx: 435.781.4329

4, Location of Well  (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, and State
Sec 12 T8S R21E NENW 788FNL 1941FWL UINTAH COUNTY, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
& Notice of Intent O Acidize O Deepen O Production (Start/Resume) O Water Shut-Off
0 Alter Casing O Fracture Treat O Reclamation O Well Integrity
O Subsequent Report [ Casing Repair O New Construction O Recomplete & Other
O Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans (O Plug and Abandon [ Temporarily Abandon
3 Convert to Injection O Plug Back 3 Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after ail requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Shenandoah Energy Inc. hereby requests an 1 year extension on the APD for 3W-12-8-21

RECEIVED
SEP 23 2002

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND MINING

Electronic Submission #14402 verifie

14. T hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct. *
For SHENANDOAH ENERGY

by the BLM Well Information System
NC., will be sent to the Vernal

Name (Printed/Typed) RALEEN SEARLE Title REGULATORY AFFAIRS ANALYST

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

_Approved By Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Office

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

** DRAFT ** DRAFT ** DRAFT ** DRAFT ** DRAFT ** DRAFT ** DRAFT **



Form 3160-5

(Aagust 1999) D STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM APPROVED
OMB NO. 1004-0135
Expires: November 30, 2000

~ Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-0806
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an T 1 I
abandoned well. Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. - [fIndian, Allottee or Tribe Name
UTE TRIBE
. ; ; ; 7T Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side. WONSITS VALLEY

~T. Type of Well
O Oil Well & Gas Well Other

3. Well Name and No.
WONSITS VALLEY 3W-12-8-21

2. Name of Operator Contact:  RALEEN SEARLE G, API Well No.
SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC. E-Maii: rsearle@shenandoahenergy.com 43-047-34267

“3a. Address 6. Phone No. (include area code) T0. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH Ph: 435.781.4309 WONSITS VALLEY

VERNAL, UT 84078 Fx: 435.781.4329

T Tocation of Well  (Footage, Sec., 1., R., M., or Survey Description) e TT. County or Parish, and State

Sec 12 T8S R21E NENW 788FNL 1941FWL s } UINTAH COUNTY, UT

Ll 20 2002
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
2 Notice of Intent O Acidize - 0 Deepen O Productlo.n (Start/Resume) o Water Shut-Off
[ Alter Casing ) Fracture Treat ) Reclamation g Well Integrity
[ Subsequent Report [ Casing Repair 03 New Construction [ Recomplete gg Other

Final Abandonment Notice Change Plans
O ]

Convert to Injection Plug Back
O O

O Plug and Abandon

O Temporarily Abandon
g Water Disposal

T3 Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, Including estimated starting date oT any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.

If the proposal is to deepen directionaily or recomplete horizontally,

Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports
If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
filed only after all requirements,

following completion of the involved operations.
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Shenandoah Energy Inc. hereby requests an 1 year extension on the ﬁgfé EIY\VE861 -

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING !

AR
i

et

CONDITIONS OF APPR

OVAL ATTACHED

give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.

shall be filed within 30 days

including reclamation, have, been completed, and the operator has

T4, Thereby certily that the foregoing is true and correct.

Electronic Submission #14402 veriﬁeJI by the BLM Well Information System

For SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC., sent to the Vernal
Committed to AFMSS for processing|by LESLIE WALKER on 12/03/2002 ()
Name (Printed/Typed) RALEEN SEARLE Title ~REGULATORY AFFAIRS ANALYST
Signature (Electronic Submission) Date  11/26/2002
THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE
~ ‘ : Datr . B \vzisio-
Approved By ﬁ M{ﬁf Title etroleum E’nqme@ Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Office

Titic 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime Tor any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

* ORIGINAL **

7]
o)

3
$
{y

LA

= PRIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL **



Shenandoah Energy Inc.
APD Extension
Well: Wonsits Valley 3W-12-8-21 Location: NENW Sec. 12, T8S, R21E
Lease: UTU 0806
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

An extension for the referenced APD is granted with the following conditions:

1. The extension will expire 11/01/03
2. No other extensions beyond that time frame will be granted or allowed.

If you have any other questions concerning this matter, please contact Kirk Fleetwood of this
office at (435) 781-4486



OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

Change of Operator (Well Sold)

ROUTING

1. GLH

2.CDW

3. FILE

Designation of Agent/Operator

X Operator Name Change Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 2/1/2003
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):

N4235-Shenandoah Energy Inc
11002 E 17500 S
Vernal, UT 84078-8526

N2460-QEP Uinta Basin Inc
11002 E 17500 S
Vernal, UT 84078-8526

Phone: (435) 781-4341 Phone: (435) 781-4341

CA No. Unit: WONSITS VALLEY UNIT
WELL(S)
NAME SECTWN |RNG |API NO ENTITY {LEASE |WELL [WELL |Con™

NO TYPE |TYPE |STATUS

WV 16W-10-8-21 10 1080S |210E |4304734250 12436]|Federal {GW P
WV 1W-11-8-21 11 ]080S |210E (4304734263 Federal |[GW APD C
WV 2W-11-8-21 11 ]080S |210E |4304734264 Federal |GW APD C
WV 3W-11-8-21 11 |080S |210E |4304734266 Federal [GW APD C
WV 5W-11-8-21 11 j080S |210E (4304734269 Federal |[GW APD C
WV 6W-12-8-21 12 |080S |210E (4304734245 12436{Federal |GW TA
WV 12W-12-8-21 12 |080S [210E |4304734248 12436{Federal |GW TA
WV 2W-12-8-21 12 }080S |210E 4304734265 12436|Federal |GW DRL C
WV 3W-12-8-21 12 1080S |210E 14304734267 Federal |GW APD C
WV 4W-12-8-21 12 |080S |210E [4304734268 Federal |GW APD C
WV 4W-14-8-21 14 |080S {210E (4304734244 12436|Federal |GW P
WV 2W-15-8-21 15 1080S |210E {4304734242 12436]|Federal  |GW P
WV 7W-15-8-21 15 {080S |210E |4304734246 12436|Federal |GW P
WV 8§W-15-8-21 15 |080S [210E |4304734247 12436|Federal |GW P
WV 14W-15-8-21 15 |080S |210E |4304734249 12436|Federal |GW P
WV 16W-15-8-21 15 |080S |210FE |4304734251 12436|Federal  |GW P
WV 14W-16-8-21 16 |080S {210E (4304734192 12436/|State GW P
WV 15W-16-8-21 16 1080S |210E (4304734224 12436|State GW P
WV 16W-16-8-21 16 |080S |210E |4304734225 12436|State GW P
WV 2W-22.8-21 22 1080S |210E [4304734243 12436|Federal |GW P
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2003
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on:  6/2/2003
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/19/2003
4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 5292864-0151

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

QEP UB 49 FORM B.xls

20



. Q

-

6. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: 7/21/2003

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 7/21/2003

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC")  The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,

for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: n/a
DATA ENTRY:
I.  Changes entered in the Qil and Gas Database on: 9/16/2003
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 9/16/2003
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: n/a
4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: n/a

STATE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965-003-032

FEDERAL WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024

INDIAN WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION: -
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 799446

FEE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965-003-033

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
The Division sent response by letter on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS:

QEP UB 49 FORM B.xIs



JUL 07 2003
3104 (932.34)WF
Nationwide Bond ESB000024
NOTICE
QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. : Oil and Gas

1050 17® Street Suite 500 : lease
Denver, Colorado 80265 :

Name Change Recognized

Acceptable evidence has been filed in this office concerning the name change of Shenandoah
Energy Incorporated into QEP Uinta Basin, Incorporated. QEP Uinta Basin, Incorporated is the
surviving entity. This name change is recognized effective April 17, 2003.

Eastern States will notify the Minerals Management Service and all applicable Bureau of Land
Management offices of the change by a copy of this notice.

If you identify other leases in which the merging entity maintain an interest, please contact thls
office and we will appropriately document those files with a copy of this notice.

If you have any questions, please contact Bill Forbes at 703-440-1536.

S/L'Uc'l/ow-%- 5 focbes

Wilbert B. Forbes

Land Law Examiner

Branch of Use Authorization

Division of Resources Planning,
Use and Protection

be: JFO,MMS, ES RF, 930 RF, 932.34 RF, E-932: wbf:07 /07/03:440-1536/ QEP Unita Basin
MFo



SEI (N4235) to QEP (N2460) WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

well_n’zIr—ﬁé Sec |T R api Entity |Lease Type |type |[stat unit_name field county |type|lease # bond #
WVU 16 15 {080S |210E ]4304715447 5265|Federal |WI |A WONSITS VALLEY 710|S [UINTAH| 1{U-0807  [UT-0969
wvu2r - 16 |080S_[210E 4304715452 99990/ State WL |A WONSITS VALLEY 710]S |UINTAH| 3|ML-2237 [159261960
wvu3r S 14 1080S [210E [4304715460 5265|Federal |WI |A WONSITS VALLEY 710[S [UINTAH| 1{U-0807 |UT-0969
WVU35 T 14 [080S [210E ]4304715463 5265|Federal |WI |A WONSITS VALLEY 710]S |UINTAH|[ 1]U-0807 |UT-0969
WVuU3e - |10 080S |210E (4304715464 5265|Federal (W1 [A WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1]U-0806  [UT-0969
'WvU a1 i 15 [080S [210E [4304715469 5265|Federal |WI |A WONSITS VALLEY 710[S [UINTAH| 1{U-0807 [UT-0969
WVU 43 - ~11r_losos [210E (4304715471 5265|Federal |OW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S [UINTAH| 1{U-0806 |[UT-0969
wVU 48 10 [080S [210E [4304715476 5265|Federal |OW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH| 1]U-0806 |UT-0969
WVU 50 15 [080S [210E 14304715477 5265|Federal |WI |A WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |[UINTAH| 1[U-0807 [UT-0969
WVU 32 16 |080S [210E 4304716513 5265|State ow |p WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH| 3|ML-2237 [159261960
WVU 53 10 [080S [210E [4304720003 5265[Federal |OW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S [UINTAH| 1]U-0806 |UT-0969
WVU 55 14 [080S [210E 14304720005 5265|Federal |OW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S JUINTAH| 1{U-0807 [UT-0969
VU 59 14 [080S [210E [4304720018 5265|Federal |WI |A WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |[UINTAH| 1[U-0807 [UT-0969
#vu 60 15 1080S [210E (4304720019 5265|Federal |WI |A WONSITS VALLEY 710[S [UINTAH| 1{U-0807 |UT-0969
VU 62 10 [080S [210E [4304720024 5265|Federal  |OW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH| 1]{U-0806 |UT-0969
wVU 65 B 15 [080S [210E (4304720041 5265|Federal  [OW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S JUINTAH| 1{U-0807 |UT-0969
WVU 67 ] 15 1080S [210E [4304720043 5265|Federal |WI |A WONSITS VALLEY 710[S [UINTAH| 1[U-0807 |UT-0969
WVU 68 - 15 ]080S [210E [4304720047 5265|Federal |WI |A WONSITS VALLEY 710[S JUINTAH| 1]U-0807 |UT-0969
'WVU 72 o 16 |080S [210E |4304720058 99990|State wl |A WONSITS VALLEY 710]S [UINTAH] 3]ML-2237A 1159261960
wWvu7s ~lie_[080S [210E [4304720066 5265/ State Wl |A WONSITS VALLEY 710{S JUINTAH| 3|ML-2237 [159261960
WVU 74 16 |080S [210E [4304720078 5265|State oW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710]S |UINTAH| 3[ML-2237 [159261960
WVU75 16 |080S [210E |4304720085 5265/ State ow [P WONSITS VALLEY 710]S [UINTAH|[ 3[ML-2237 (159261960
WVU 78 16 |080S [210E |4304720115 99990|State wl |A WONSITS VALLEY 710[S [UINTAH| 3[ML-2237 [159261960
wvugy 23 |080S [210E 4304720205 12436|Federal  |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S [UINTAH| 1{U-0809 [UT-0969
WVU 97 ] 11 1080S |210FE [4304730014 5265|Federal |WI |A WONSITS VALLEY 710[S [UINTAH| 1{U-0806 |UT-0969
WVU 103 B 14 [080S [210E (4304730021 5265|Federal |OW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |[UINTAH| 1][U-0807 |UT-0969
WVU 104 - 15 [080S [210E |4304730022 5265|Federal  [OW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710/S [UINTAH| 1{U-0807 |UT-0969
wvuios 10 ]080S [210E [4304730023 5265|Federal  |OW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S [UINTAH| 1{U-0806 |UT-0969
wvuioy ) 15 |080S |210E |4304730045 5265|Federal |OW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH| 1]{U-0807 |UT-0969
WVU 110 B 114 |080S |210E 4304730046 5265|Federal  |OW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S JUINTAH| 1]U-0807 |UT-0969
VU112 15 |080S [210E |4304730048 5265|Federal [OW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH| 1[U-0807 |UT-0969
VU 124 i 15 [080S [210E |4304730745 5265|Federal |OW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1]U-0806
VU 126 ) 21 |080S [210E (4304730796 5265|Federal |WI |A WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH| 1]U-0804 [UT-0969
WvU 128 10 080S |210E [4304730798 5265|Federal |OW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |[UINTAH| 1{U-0806 |UT-0969
WVU 132 - 15 [080S [210E 4304730822 5265|Federal |OW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH| 1]U-0807 |UT-0969
WVU 136 121 ]080S [210E [4304731047 5265|Federal |OW |P WONSITS VALLEY | 710[S |UINTAH] 1]U-0804 [UT-0969
WVU 134 ~ 16 |080S [210E 4304731118 5265 State ow [p WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 3[ML-2237 [159261960
WVU 137 11 [080S [210E [4304731523 5265|Federal |OW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S [UINTAH| 1[U-0806 |UT-0969
wvU28-2 11 [080S [210E [4304731524 99990|Federal |WI |A WONSITS VALLEY 710]S |[UINTAH[ 1{U-0806 |UT-0969
wvui4ar i 16 [080S [210E [4304731609 5265|State ow [p WONSITS VALLEY 710[S {UINTAH| 3[ML-2237 (159261960
wvu 127 o 16 |080S [210E 4304731611 5265|State ow |p WONSITS VALLEY 710[S [UINTAH| 3|ML-2237 [159261960
wvuig2 16 [080S [210E [4304731612 5265|State ow [P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S [UINTAH| 3|ML-2237 [159261960
wvyigsz 15 1080S [210E [4304731706 5265|Federal |OW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710]S [UINTAH| 1{U-0807 [UT-0969
wvui40 15 |080S [210E [4304731707 5265|Federal |WI |A WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1]U-0807 |UT-0969
wvu402 10 [080S |210E (4304731798 5265|Federal |WI |A WONSITS VALLEY 710]S |UINTAH] 1][U-0806 |UT-0969
0&g db sorted 1 9/11/2003




) SEI (N4235) to QEP (N2460) WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

well_name Sec |T R api Entity |Lease Type |type

stat unit_name field county |type|lease # bond #
WVU 144 10 1080S |210E 14304731807 5265{Federal [OW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710/S |UINTAH| 1]U-0806 UT-0969
WVU 143 10 |1080S |210E (4304731808 5265|Federal [WI |A WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH| 1[U-0806 UT-0969
WVU 145 } 18 |080S |220E 14304731820 12436|Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S JUINTAH| 1[/U-057 UT-0969
WVU 121 14 1080S |210E |4304731873 5265|Federal |OW |S WONSITS VALLEY 710{S JUINTAH| 1|U-0807 UT-0969
IWVU 1352 ) 21 |080S |210E [4304732016 5265|Federal |OW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1]|U-0804 UT-0969
WVUu 130 - 22 1080S |210E 4304732307 5265|Federal {OW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1{U-0804 UT-0969
WVU 71-2 15 J080S |210E [4304732449 5265|Federal  [WI 1A WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH; 1{U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 119 21 |080S |210E 14304732461 5265{Federal |OW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |JUINTAH| 1]{U-0804 UT-0969
WVFU 120 22 |080S |210E 14304732462 5265|Federal  |WI |A WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1[U-0804 UT-0969
WVFU 54 WG - 07 1080S |220E [4304732821 12436[Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH| 1/U-22158 [UT-0969
WVFU 69 WG 18 1080S {220E [4304732829 12436|Federal |GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S JUINTAH| 1[{U-057 UT-0969
WVFU 38 WG 08 |080S 1220E 4304732831 12436{Federal |GW |{P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH| 1jU-022158 [UT-0969
WVFU 49 WG » 08 |080S |220E (4304732832 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH| 1]/U-022158 |UT-0969
QVFU 1383WG 18 1080S |220E [4304733054 12436|Federal  |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S JUINTAH| 1{U-057 UT-0969
VFU 14 WG o 12 ]080S [210E (4304733070 12436{Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1|U-806 UT-0969
WVFU I WG |12 1080S |210E [4304733085 12436{Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1[{U-0806 UT-0969
'\j{_\_/_lj‘y_gi‘lﬁ\)_v_@ o 24 1080S 1210E 14304733086 12436|Federal |[GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1[{U-0810 UT-0969
WVFU 146 WG ) o 19 1080S 220E 14304733128 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 630!S |UINTAH| 1|U-057 UT-0969
WVFU 1W- 14-8- 21 o 14 1080S 1210E [4304733220 12436[Federal  |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH|] 1|U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 5W-13- 8- 21 o 13 {080S |210E [4304733221 12436{Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S [UINTAH| 1[U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 9W-13-8-21 ] 13 1080S |210E (4304733223 12436 State GwW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 3{ML-3084A [159261960
7\}/*\{597{16 WG - 07 1080S |220E [4304733241 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1jU-022158 |UT-0969
WVFU 2W-16-8-21 16 |OROS [210E 14304733246 12436|State GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 3/ML-2237 159261960
WVFU 2G-16-8-21 S 16 |080S |210E (4304733247 5265 State ow |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S [UINTAH| 3|ML-2237 |159261960
WVFU 9W-14-8-21 ) |14 |080S |210E [4304733269 12436 |Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1]|U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 7W-13-8-21 13 |0B0S |210E |4304733270 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1]U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 1W-18-8-22 ) 18 |080S [220E |4304733294 12436/Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1,U-057 UT-0969
WVFU 11W-8-8-22 08 |080S |220E 4304733295 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH! 1]U-022158 [UT-0969
WVFU 3W-§8-8-22 o 08 |080S |220E [4304733493 12436 |Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710/S |UINTAH| 1]U-022158 |UT-0969
WVFU 5W-7-8-22 07 [080S [220E 14304733494 12436 Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1/U-022158 |UT-0969
VFU 11w-7.8-22 07 |080S |220E (4304733495 12436/Federal  |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1{U-022158 [UT-0969
dwmwjizz 107 |080S |220E |4304733496 12436 |Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |JUINTAH| 1/U-022158 {UT-0969
VFU 1W-7-8-22 ] 07 |080S |220E 14304733501 12436/Federal |GW (P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1/U-022158 [UT-0969
WVFU 3W-7-8-22 07 |0B0S |220E |4304733502 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1]U-022158 |UT-0969
WV 7TWRG-7-8-22 107 |080S |[220E [4304733503 5265|Federal [OW [P WONSITS VALLEY ~ 710jS |UINTAH| 1|UTU-02215UT-0969
WVFU 6W-16-8-21 16 |080S |210E (4304733527 12436|State Gw |P C |WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 3|ML-2237 [159261960
WVFU 16W-9-8-21 _ 109 |080S |210E |4304733529 | 12436|Federal |GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1|U-0805 UT-0969
WVFU | IW 12- 8- 21 B _ 112 1080S |210E (4304733531 12436{Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY | __710|]S |UINTAH| 1;U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU IW-13-8-21 ) 13 |080S |210E |4304733532 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1|U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 3W-18-8-22 ) 18 1080S |220E |4304733533 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710/S |UINTAH| 1|U-057 UT-0969
WVFU 9W-12-8-21 N 12 1080S |210E |4304733534 | 12436|Federal |GW |P | |WONSITS VALLEY ~710{S |UINTAH| 1/U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU | 1W-12- 8-21 12 1080S |210E [4304733535 12436/Federal  |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1|U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 11W-13-8- 221 ) 13 |080S |210E |4304733536 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH] 1|U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 13W-12-8-21 ) |12 |080S |210E |4304733537 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1|U-0806 UT-0969
IWVFU 13w-18-8-22 118 |080S [220E [4304733538 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1iU-057 UT-0969

0&g db sorted 2 9/11/2003



SE (N4235) to QEP (N2460) WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

well_name Sec |T R api Entity |Lease Type |type |stat unit_name field county |type|lease # bond #
WVFU 6G-16-8-21 16 ]080S |210E 14304733564 5265|State ow |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH| 3|ML-2237 (159261960
WVFU 16G-9-8-21 09 [080S [210E |4304733565 5265|Federal |OW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1|U-0805 UT-0969
WVFU 1W-21-8-21 21 |080S j210E (4304733602 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1|UTU-68217UT-0969
WVFU 3W-13-8-21 |13 [080S |{210E |4304733603 12436 |Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1]U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 3W-22-8-21 ) 22 |080S [210E |4304733604 12436/Federal  |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1|U-0804 UT-0969
WVFU 3W-24-8-21 24 |080S [210E |4304733605 12436{Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1]U-0810 UT-0969
WVFU 13W-13-8-21 13 |080S |210E |4304733606 12436|Federal  |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1]U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 13W-14-8-21 14 1080S |210E /4304733607 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710/S |UINTAH{ 1]|U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 15W-13-8-21 13 1080S |210E |4304733608 12436|Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710/S |UINTAH| 1]|U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 1W-24-8-21 24 1080S |210E |4304733613 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1]U-0810 UT-0969
WVFU 11W-18-8-22 o 18 |080S [220E |4304733626 12436|Federal  |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1{U-057 UT-0969
WVFU 16W-2-8-21 02 |0B0S |[210E 14304733645 | 5265|State ow |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 3|ML-2785 [159261960
VFU 9W-2-8-21 02 1080S [210E [4304733648 12436/ State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 2|S JUINTAH| 3|ML-2785 [159261960
VFU 12W-16-8-21 16 |080S [210E |4304733649 12436|State GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 3|ML-2237 [159261960
WVFU 12G-16-8-21 116 |0BOS |210E (4304733650 5265|State Oow |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 3|ML-2237 [159261960
WVFU 2W-10-8-21 10 |080S |210E [4304733655 12436 |Federal  |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1;U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 4W-11-8-21 11 1080S |210E |4304733657 12436|Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH| 1]U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 12W-10-8-21 L 10 |080S |210E |4304733659 12436|Federal  |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710/S |UINTAH| 1|U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 12G-10-8-21 10 |080S |210E |4304733660 5265|Federal |OW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1]|U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 15W-9-8-21 o 09 1080S |210E 14304733661 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1|U-0805 UT-0969
WVFU 15G-9-8-21 09 |080S |210E 4304733662 | 5265|Federal |[OW [P WONSITS VALLEY ~ 710|S |UINTAH| 1|U-0805 UT-0969
WVFU 2W-13-8-21 13 |080S |210E 14304733791 12436|Federal  |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S [UINTAH!| 1]U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 6W-13-8-21 13 |080S |210E 14304733792 12436|Federal |GW (P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1|U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 8§W-13-8-21 13 1080S |210E 14304733793 12436 |Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710/S |UINTAH| 1{U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 10W-1-8-21 01 |080S |210E [4304733794 12436|Federal |GW |S WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1}U-0802 UT-0969
WVFU 10W-13-8-21 13 1080S |210E (4304733795 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710/S |UINTAH| 1|U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 16W7 13-8-21 13 |080S [210E |4304733796 12436|State GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 3|ML-3084 |159261960
WVFU 12W-7-8-22 07 |080S |220E /4304733808 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710/S |UINTAH| 1{U-022158 |UT-0969
WVFU 6W-8-8-22 08 1080S |220E (4304733811 12436|Federal  |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1]{U-022158 |UT-0969
WVFU 7W-8-8-22 . 08 |080S |220E {4304733812 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH| 1]U-022158 [UT-0969
VFU I0W-7-8-22 07 1080S |220E [4304733813 12436{Federal |GW (P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1]U-022158 [UT-0969
JVFU 10W-8-8-22 08 |080S [220E [4304733814 13450|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH| 1}U-022158 ![UT-0969
VFU 12W-8-8-22 o 08 080S [220E [4304733815 12436/Federal  |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710/S |UINTAH| 1]U-022158 |UT-0969
WVFU 14W-7-8-22 07 |080S [220E [4304733816 12436{Federal  |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1}jU-022158 [UT-0969
WVFU 16W-7-8-22 _ 07 {080S 1220E (4304733817 12436|Federal  |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1]U-022158 [UT-0969
WVFU 6W-7-8-22 07 |0B0S |220E {4304733828 12436/Federal  |GW_|P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S JUINTAH| 1jU-022158 |UT-0969
WVFU 6W-18-8-22 18 [080S [220E [4304733842 12436|Federal  |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1]U-057 UT-0969
WVFU 6WC-18-8-22 18 |080S {220E {4304733843 12436|Federal  |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S JUINTAH]| 1jU-057 UT-0969
IWVFU 6WD-18-8-22 18 |080S [220E (4304733844 12436{Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1]{U-057 UT-0969
WVFU 5W-23-8-21 23 10808 [210E [4304733860 12436|Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH{ 1|U-0809 UT-0969
WVFU 7W-2 23 _8k2l 23 |080S [210E [4304733861 12436[Federal  |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710/{S |UINTAH| 1]U-0809 UT-0969
WVFU §W-12-8-21 o 12 |080S [210E [4304733862 12436|Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1]U-0806 UT-0969
IWVFU 10wW-12-8-21 12 |080S [210E [4304733863 12436{Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S [UINTAH| 1]U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 14W-12-8-21 |12 1080S |210E 4304733864 12436(Federal  |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH| 1]U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU T6W-12- 8 21 12 {080S [210E 4304733865 12436|Federal  |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S JUINTAH| 1]U-0806 UT-0969
0&g db sorted 3 9/11/2003




SEI (N4235) to QEP (N2460) WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

well_name T o Sec |T R api Entity |Lease Type |type |stat unit_name field county |type|lease # bond #
WVFU Iw-15-21 15 |[080S {210E {4304733902 12436{Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S [UINTAH| 1{U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 1W-22-8-21 22 |080S |210E |4304733903 12436|Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S [UINTAH| 1|UTU-06304UT-0969
WVFU 1W-23-8-21 L 23 1080S |210E |4304733904 12436|Federal (GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S [UINTAH| 1|U-0809 UT-0969
WVFU 6W-11-8-21 ) 11 1080S {210E (4304733906 12436{Federal {GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S [UINTAH| 1]U-0806 UT-0969
WV 7W-22-8-21 |22 |080S [210E [4304733907 13230{Federal |GW {P WONSITS VALLEY 710(S [UINTAH| 1[|U-0804 UT-0969
WVFU 7W-24-8-21 - ) 24 |080S |210E {4304733908 12436{Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710}S {UINTAH| 1}jU-0810 UT-0969
WVFU 10W-11-8-21 11 [080S [210E (4304733910 12436{Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S {UINTAH| 1}U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 11W-15-8-21 15 |080S |210E (4304733911 12436|Federal |GW (P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH! 1!1U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 1 1W-17-8-21 17 [080S {210E [4304733912 13228|Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 2|1S |UINTAH| 1{UTU-68219UT-0969
WVFU 13W-11-8-21 11 {080S {210E [4304733913 12436|Federal {GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710(S [UINTAH| 1{U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 13W-15-8-21 15 [080S [210E (4304733914 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1]{U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 15W-10-8-2¢ 10 |080S [210E (4304733916 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1[U-0806 UT-0969
VFU I5W-15-8-21 15 (080S 1210E {4304733917 12436|Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1|U-0807 UT-0969
yﬁliU_S\j\{ -14-8-21 14 |080S [210E [4304733953 12436{Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S {UINTAH| 1]U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 7W-14-8-21 14 [080S_[210E_|4304733955 12436|Federal  |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710]S |UINTAH| 1]U-0807  |UT-0969
WVFU 8W-11-8-21 11 |080S |210E (4304733957 12436{Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1]|U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 8W-14-8-21 B ~ 14 {080S |210E {4304733958 12436{Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{1S JUINTAH| 1]|U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 9W-15-8-21 15 |080S [210E {4304733959 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1{U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 12W-13-8-21 13 {080S |210E (4304733961 12436{Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S [UINTAH| 1{U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 14W-13-8-21 ~ 13 |080S [210E (4304733962 12436{Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH| 1|UTU-0806 [UT-0969
WVFU 15W-14-8-21 14 |080S [210E {4304733963 12436{Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710(S |UINTAH| 1[U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 2W-18-8-22 - 18 |080S |220E {4304733986 12436{Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1[{U-057 UT-0969
WV 8W-18-8-22 o 18 |080S [220E [4304733989 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S [UINTAH| 1[{U-9617 UT-0969
WVFU 10W-18-8-22 18 [080S |220E 4304733991 12436{Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1|U-057 UT-0969
\WVFU 12w-18-8-22 |18 |080S |220E 14304733993 12436{Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH{ 1{U-057 UT-0969
WV [4W-18-8-22 3 18 |080S |[220E {4304733995 12436{Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1|{U-057 UT-0969
WVFU 6W-1-8-21 01 |080S |[210E |4304734008 Federal |GW |[APD WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1|U-0802 UT-0969
WVFU 8W-{-8-21 01 {080S [210E 4304734009 12436{Federal |GW |DRL WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1{U-0802 UT-0969
WV 1003-2-8-21 02 |[0BOS [210E 4304734035 5265|State ow |P WONSITS VALLEY 2!1S [UINTAH 3IML-2785 159261960
(WV 14G-2-8-21 02 |080S {210E (4304734036 5265!|State ow |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH 3[ML-2785 159261960
V 4WV]Z § 22 17 (080S |220E (4304734038 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S [UINTAH| 1[U-055 UT-0969
v‘\_{__l___6w>__!m8_ 2y 01 |080S {210E {4304734047 Federal |GW |APD WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1]|U-0802 UT-0969
WV 13G-2-8-21 02 080S {210E 4304734068 5265|State ow |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S [UINTAH{ 3{ML-2785-Al159261960
WV 5G-16-8-21 B 16 |080S [210E [4304734107 5265|State - Oow [P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 3(ML-2237 ]159261960
'WV 12G- 1-8-21 N 101 1080S {210E [4304734108 5265|Federal {OW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1|U-0802 UT-0969
WV 2W-14- 8 21 14 [080S [210E (4304734140 12436|Federal {GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S [UINTAH| 1]UTU-0807 |U-0969
GH 2W-21-8-21 - 21 [080S |210E {4304734141 12436{Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S [UINTAH| 1|UTU-0804 |U-0969
WV 2w-23-8-21 ) 23 |080S {210E {4304734142 12436|Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S {UINTAH|{ 1]UTU-0809 {U-0969
|GH 3W-21-8-21 21 |080S [210E [4304734143 12436|Federal |GW (P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S [UINTAH| 1]UTU-0804 {U-0969
WV 4W-13-8-21 13 |080S [210E |4304734144 12436|Federal {GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S [UINTAH| 1|UTU-0806 {UT-0969
GH 4W-21-8-2 21 21 |0BOS |[210E [4304734145 12436{Federal {GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |[UINTAH| 1{UTU-0804 |UT-0969
WV 4W- 22-8- 21 22 |080S 1210E {4304734146 12436|Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH| 1{UTU-0804 |U-0969
WV 16W-11-8-2] B 11 |080S [210E [4304734155 12436{Federal |GW |S WONSITS VALLEY 710{S {UINTAH| 1[{UTU-0806 |UT-0969
WV 3W-19-8-22 19 [080S |[220E [4304734187 12436]Federal |GW (P WONSITS VALLEY 630{S |UINTAH| 1|UTU-057 |UT-0969
WV 4W-23-8-21 23 |080S |210E [4304734188 12436{Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S [UINTAH| 1|UTU-809 {UT-0969
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SEI (N4235) to QEP (N2460) WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

Wcﬂ:ﬁiiﬁi'eﬁ o o Sec |T R api Entity |Lease Type |type |stat unit_name field county |[type|lease # bond #
WV 6W-23-8-21 23 |080S |210E [4304734189 12436(Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S JUINTAH| 1|UTU-809 |UT-0969
WV 11W-16-8-21 ) 16 |080S [210E [4304734190 12436(State GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710/S |UINTAH| 3|ML-2237 [159261960
WV 13W-16-8-21 ) 16 {080S |210E (4304734191 12436|State GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 3|ML-2237A (159261960
WV 14W-16-8-21 o 16 1080S |210E (4304734192 12436(State GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 3|ML-2237 [159261960
WV [5W-16-8-21 16 1080S |210E [4304734224 12436|State GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 3{ML-2237 ]159261960
WV 16W-16-8-21 16 |080S |210E (4304734225 12436|State GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 3{ML-2237A]159261960
WV 2W-15-8-21 15 |08B0S [210E [4304734242 12436|Federal [GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710/S JUINTAH| 1|UTU-0807 [UT-0969
WV 2W-22-8-21 |22 |080S "|210E {4304734243 12436|Federal [GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710/S |UINTAH| 1{UTU-0804 {UT-0969
WV 4w-148-21 14 {080S |210E [4304734244 12436(Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1[U-0807 UT-0969
WV 6W-12-8-21 3 12 |080S [210E (4304734245 12436(Federal |GW [TA WONSITS VALLEY 710(S |UINTAH| 1]U-0806 UT-0969
WV 7W-15-8-21 15 {080S |210E [4304734246 12436|Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710/S JUINTAH{ 1]|U-0807 UT-0969
WV 8W-15-8-21 - 15 |080S |210E [4304734247 12436|Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1|UTU-0807 [UT-0969
V 12W-12-8-21 - 12 |0BOS 210E (4304734248 12436|Federal IGW [TA WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1]U-0806 UT-0969
V 14W-15-8-21 15 |080S |210E [4304734249 12436|Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S JUINTAH| 1]UTU-0807 |UT-0969
WV 16W-10-8-21 10 |08B0S |210E (4304734250 12436{Federal |[GW ([P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1{UTU-0806 |UT-0969
WV 16W-15-8-21 15 |080S |210E (4304734251 12436{Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S JUINTAH| 1{UTU-0807 |UT-0969
WV IW-11-8-21 ) 11 |080S |210E [4304734263 Federal [GW |APD [C |WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1]UTU-0806 |UT-0969
WV 2W-11-8-21 _ 11 |080S [210E {4304734264 Federal [GW |APD {C |WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH[ 1|UTU-0806 |UT-0969
WV 2W-12-8-21 12 |080S [210E |4304734265 12436|Federal |GW |DRL [C |WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1{UTU-0806 {UT-0969
WV 3W-11-8-21 o 11 |0B0S |210E (4304734266 Federal IGW |APD |C [WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1]UTU-0806 |UT-0969
WV 3W-12-8-21 12 |080S [210E 14304734267 Federal |GW |APD [C |WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1]UTU-0806 [UT-0969
WV 4w.-12-8-21 ~ |12 ]080S [210E 14304734268 Federal |GW |APD {C |WONSITS VALLEY 710{S JUINTAH| 1{UTU-0806 |UT-0969
WV 5W-11-8-21 B . 11 |0BOS [210E [4304734269 Federal |GW |APD |[C |WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1{UTU-0806 [UT-0969
WV 5W-12-8-21 112 |080S |210E {4304734270 12436|Federal |GW |DRL |C [WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1{UTU-0806 |[UT-0969
WV 6W-14-8-21 |14 ]080S [210E [4304734271 12436|Federal  |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S_[UINTAH| _1|UTU-0807 [UT-0969
WV 9W-11-8-21 |11 |080S {210E ]4304734274 Federal |GW |APD |C |WONSITS VALLEY 710/S JUINTAH| [1{UTU-0806 {UT-0969
WV 10W-14-8-21 N 14 |080S J210E [4304734275 12436|Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1|UTU-0807 |UT-0969
WV 1IW-11-8-21 ) |11 |080S |210E [4304734276 Federal |GW |APD |C |WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1]UTU-0806 {UT-0969
WV T11W-14-8-21 14 [080S |210E [4304734277 12436|Federal_|GW_|P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1/UTU-0807 [UT-0969
WV 12W-11-8-21 11 |0B0OS [210E (4304734278 Federal [GW |APD (C [WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH! 1{UTU-0806 |UT-0969
VI12w-14-8-21 14 |080S |210E [4304734279 12436|Federal |GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S [UINTAH| 1{UTU-0807 |UT-0969
‘V 14Ww-11-8-21 11 1080S |210E {4304734280 Federal |GW |APD [C [WONSITS VALLEY 710/S JUINTAH| 1}UTU-0806 [UT-0969
WV 14W-14-8-21 14 1080S [210E [4304734281 12436|Federal |GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1|UTU-0807 |UT-0969
WV I5W-i1-8-21 - 11 |0BOS |210E (4304734282 Federal |GW |APD |C |WONSITS VALLEY 710{S JUINTAH| 1]UTU-0806 {UT-0969
WV 16W-14-8-21 ~ 14 1080S [210E (4304734283 5265|Federal [OW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710/S |UINTAH| 1{UTU-0807 [UT-0969
WV IW-16-8-21 ~ 16 |080S [210E {4304734288 State GW_|APD |C [WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH[ 3|ML-2237 ]159261960
WV3w-is-8-21 15 |080S |210E (4304734289 Federal |GW {APD [C |WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1|UTU-0807 |UT-0969
WV 3IW-16-8-21 16 |080S |210E [4304734290 State GW |APD |C |[WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 3|ML-2237 [159261960
WV 4W-15-8-21 15 |080S |210E [4304734291 Federal [GW |APD |[C [WONSITS VALLEY 710|S [UINTAH| 1{UTU-0807 [UT-0969
WV 4W-16-8-21 B 16 |080S 1210E 4304734292 State GW_[APD [C |WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH! 3|ML-2237 }159261960
WV 5W-15-8-21 15 |080S |210E [4304734293 Federal [GW |APD |C |WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1|UTU-0807 [UT-0969
WV 6W-15-8-21 15 {080S |210E {4304734294 12436{Federal |GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S JUINTAH| 1]UTU-0807 |UT-0969
WV 10W-15-8-21 15 |080S [210E (4304734295 12436{Federal (GW [P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S JUINTAH| 1{UTU-0807 {UT-0969
WVU 5W-16-8-21 ) 16 |080S |210E (4304734321 12436|State GW [DRL WONSITS VALLEY 710[S JUINTAH| 3IML-2237 [04127294
WV Iw-16-8-21 16 |080S |210E |4304734322 12436|State Gw |P WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH{ 3|ML-2237 |159261960
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SEI (N4235) to QEP (N2460) WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

well_name Sec |T R api Entity |Lease Type |type |stat unit_name field county |type|lease # bond #
WV EW-16-8-21 16 |080S [210E (4304734323 State GW_[APD WONSITS VALLEY 710{S [UINTAH| 3iML-2237 [159261960
WV 9W-16-8-21 16 |080S [210E [4304734325 12436|State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710{S [UINTAH| 3|ML-2237 1159261960
WV 10W-16-8-21 16 |080S |210E [4304734326 12436|State GwW_|P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH| 3{ML-2237 1159261960
WVU 4W-24-8-21 24 |080S [210E [4304734330 12436/Federal [GW |P WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH| 1|UTU-0810 |U-0969
WVU 2W-24-8-21 24 |080S |210E }4304734337 Federal |GW |APD |{C |WONSITS VALLEY 710{S jUINTAH| 1|UTU-0810 {UT-0969
WVU 6W-24-8-21 24 1080S |210E (4304734338 Federal |GW [APD [C |[WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1{UTU-0810 jUT-0969
WVU 8W-23-8-2]1 23 |080S [210E {4304734339 Federal [GW [APD |C [WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1|UTU-0809 |{UT-0969
WVU §W-24-§-21 24 |080S [210E {4304734340 12436|Federal  |GW |P C [WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH! 1{UTU-0810 {UT-0969
WV 2G-7-8-22 07 |080S [220E [4304734355 Federal |OW |APD [C |WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1|UTU-02215UT-0969
WV 2W-7-8-22 07 |080S [220E [4304734356 Federal |GW [APD |C |WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1|UTU-02215UT-0969
wva4G-8-822 08 |080S |220E 14304734357 Federal |OW |APD |C [WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1]UTU-02215UT-0969
WV AWA-18-8-22 ) 18 |080S [220E 14304734358 Federul |GW_ JAPD [C |WONSITS VALLEY 710{S JUINTAH| 1[UTU-057 {UT-0969
WV 4WD-1§-8-22 18 |080S j220E [4304734359 Federal |GW |APD |C |WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH} 1{UTU-057 [UT-0969
‘V 13WA-18-8-22 18 |080S [220E (4304734361 Federal |GW |APD |C |WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH} 1|UTU-057 |UT-0969
WV 13WD-18-8-22 18 |080S |[220E [4304734362 Federal |GW |APD |C [WONSITS VALLEY 710]S |UINTAH| 1|JUTU-057 (UT-0969
WV 2WA-18-8-22 18 |080S [220E {4304734426 Federal |GW [APD |C [WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH| 1]UTU-057 |[UT-0969
wvaiwD-i8-822 18 |080S |220E (4304734427 Federal |GW |APD [C |WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH{ 1jUTU-057 [UT-0969
WV3WA-I188-22 |18 1080S [220E [4304734428 Federal |GW |APD {C [WONSITS VALLEY | 710[S |UINTAH| 1|UTU-057 [UT-0969
WV 3WD-18-8-22 18 |0O80S [220E |4304734429 Federal  [GW |APD [C |WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1|UTU-057 [UT-0969
WV 4W-8-8-22 08 |0BOS [220E [4304734457 Federal |GW |APD |C |WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1|UTU-02215UT-0969
WV 1W-8-8-22 08 |080S [220E [4304734467 Federal |GW |APD |C |WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 11UTU-02215UT-0969
WV 2W-§8-8-22 ) 08 |0B0S [220E (4304734468 12436|Federal |GW [P C [WONSITS VALLEY 710|S [UINTAH| 1]UTU-02215UT-0969
WV 8W-7-8-22 07 1080S [220E [4304734469 12436|Federal |GW_|DRL [C |WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1{UTU-02215UT-0969
WV §W-22-8-21 22 |080S |210E [4304734564 12436|Federal |GW [P C [WONSITS VALLEY 710[S [UINTAH| 1jUTU-0804 |U-0969
WV 3G-8-8-22 08 |080S [220E [4304734596 5265{Federal {OW |TA |C |WONSITS VALLEY 710|S JUINTAH| 1}U-022158 |U-0969
WONSITS VALLEY 1G-7-8-22 07 08B0S [220E (4304734597 Federal {|OW |APD |C [|WONSITS VALLEY 710[S JUINTAH| 1{U-022158 [U-0969
WONSITS VALLEY 5G-8-8-22 08 1080S |220E [4304734612 Federal |OW |APD |C |WONSITS VALLEY 710[S |UINTAH| 1j{UTU-02215]U-0969
WONSITS VALLEY 7G-8-8-22 08 1080S {220E [4304734613 Federal |OW |APD |C |WONSITS VALLEY 710{S [UINTAH]| 1]UTU-76508/U-0969
WV 11G-8-8-22 08 1080S [220E }4304734614 Federal |OW JAPD |C [WONSITS VALLEY 710{S |UINTAH| 1|UTU-02215U-0969
WV 13G-8-8-22 08 [080S [220E (4304734615 Federal |OW |APD |C [WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 11UTU-02215U-0969
V 15G-7-8-22 07 ]080S |220E |4304734626 Federal |OW [APD |C |[WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH| 1|UTU-02215U-0969
V 11G-7-8-22 07 [080S [220E (4304734627 Federal {OW {APD |C |WONSITS VALLEY 710[S [UINTAH{ 1]UTU-02215/U-0969
ONSITS VALLEY 7G-7-8-22 07 |080S [220E (4304734628 Federal |OW_ |APD |{C |WONSITS VALLEY 710|S |UINTAH; 1|UTU-02215/U-0969
WONSITS VALLEY 9G-7-8-22 07 1080S [220E {4304734629 Federal |OW |APD |C [WONSITS VALLEY 710[S [UINTAH| 1]UTU-02215/U-0969
WV EXT 2W-17-8-21 17 1080S [210E (4304734928 12436|Federal |GW |DRL [C |WONSITS VALLEY 610{S {UINTAH| [1{UTU-68219UT-1237
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‘star Exploration and Production Company
] ependence Plaza )
a”Esr‘ 1050 17th Street, Suite 500

Denver, CO 80265
Tel 303 672 6900 + Fax 303 294 9632

Denver Division

May 28, 2003

Division of Oil, Gas, & Mining

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P. O. Box 145801

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Attention: John Baza/Jim Thompson

Gentlemen:

This will sexrve as notice that through the internal corporate changes described below,
activities formerly conducted in the name of either Shenandoah Operating Company, LLC
(SOC) and/or Shenandoah Energy, Inc. (SEI) will hereafter be conducted in the name of
QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.: i) the Shenandoah entities were purchased in July, 2001 by Questar
Market Resources, Inc., which is a2 mid-level holding company for the non-utility businesses
of Questar Corporation, ii) Shenandoah Operating Company, LLC has now been merged
into Shenandoah Energy, Inc. (SEI), iii) Shenardoah Energy, Inc. has now been re-named
QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. pursuant to a State of Delaware Amended and Restated Certificate
of Incorporation, iv) the same employees will continue to be responsible for operations of
the former SOC and SEI properties, both in the field and in the office. Accordingly, the
change involves only an internal corporate name change and no third party change of
operator is involved. Please alter your records to reflect the entity name change. Attached is
a spreadsheet listing all wells affected by this change.

Should you have any questions, please call me at 303 - 308-3056.

Yours truly,

rank Nielsen
Division Landman

Enclosure HECE“!VED
JUN €7 2003

DIV.OF OIL, GAS & MINING



United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
uT-922

June 9, 2003

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
1050 17™ Street, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265

Re: Wonsits Valiey Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

On May 30, 2003, we received an indenture dated February 1, 2003, whereby Shenandoah Energy,
Inc. changed it name and QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. was designated as Successor Unit Operator for the
Wonsits Valley Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effective June 9, 2003.
In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the
designated party has obtained all required approval that would entitle it to conduct operations under
Wonsits Valley Unit Agreement.

Your nationwide (Eastern States) oil and gas bond No. BO00024 will be used to cover all operations
within the Wonsits Valley Unit.

Itis requested that you notify all interested parties of the name change of unit operator. Copies of
the approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriate federal offices, with one copy
returned herewith.

Sincerely,

/s/ Robert A. Henricks

Robert A. Henricks
Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure
bce:  Field Manager - Vernal (w/enclosure)
SITLA

Division of Qil, Gas & Mining

Minerals Adjudication Group

File — Wonsits Valley Unit (w/enclosure)

Agr. Sec. Chron

Fluid Chron
UT922:TAThompson:tt:6/9/03



Form 3160-5 UNITED ST ATES FORM APPROVED
) (June 1990) DE MENT OF THE INTERIOR ' Budget.Bureau No. 1004-0135
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993
5. Lease Designation and Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-0806
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals [P Ifindian, Alloties or Tribe Name
— _ Ute Tribe
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE [7. ¥ Unit or CA, Agreement Designation
1. Typeof Well ‘Wonsits Valley
oil Gas
D Wel Well E] Other ’ o J5” Well Name and No.
WV 3iw 12821
2. Name of Operator
QEP UINTA BASIN, INC. fp. APIWellNo.
3 Address and Telephone No. Contact: dahn.caldwell@questar.com 43-047-34267
11002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 435.781.4342 Fax 435.781.4357 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) WONSITS VALLEY
NENW, Sec 12, T8S, R21E |1 Coumy or Parih, Stte
788’ FNL, 1941° FWL UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans
Recompletion New Construction

Qoooad

]
[

Subsequent Report D Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing
D Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

D Final Abandonment Notice E] Altering Casing Convession to Injection
Other Spud D Dispose Water

(Note) Report results of multiple completion on Well
C leti

orR ipletion Report and Log form.)

13.  Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give perti dates, includi i d date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)

This well was spud on 9/25/03. Drilled 40° 26” hole. Set 40° 20” conductor pipe. Cement w/ 2.2 yards ready mix cement.

RECEIVED
0CT 03 2003

DIV OF OIL, GAS & i
Authorized Representative MwNG

Tide

10/01/03

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Approved by: Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any

e e
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

. 'y .
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State of Utah
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

OPERATOR: QEP, Uinta Basin, Inc.

OPERATOR ACCT. No. N-2460

ADDRESS: 11002 East 17500 South

ENTITY ACTION FORM - FORM 6 Vernal, Utah 84078-8526 (435)781-4300

Action | Current | New Entity | AP Number Well Name QQ SC | TP | RG County Spud Date Effective Date
Code Entity No.

No.
B ? Q ? 4 / 2 1/‘3& 43-047-34267 | WV 3W128 21 NENW | 12 | 8S | 21E Uintah 9/25/03 jo / ‘f /
? s B 03

WELL 1 COMMENTS: [0S T(C '

b\/ELL 2 COMMENTS:

WELL 3 COMMENTS:

WELL 4 COMMENTS:

WELL 5 COMMENTS:

‘F@TION CODES (See instructions on back of form)

NOTE: Use COMMENT section to explain why each Action Code was selected

(3/89)

A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only)
B - Add new well to existing entity (group or unit well)
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity
E - Other (explain in comments section)

C el 20

Signature

Clerk Specialist

ECEIVE

ecr

- 2003

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

10/01/03

Title

Date

Phone No. {435) 781-4342

- GO v

 CONFIENTAL

>



WONSITS VALLEY WASATCH/MESAVERDE/MANCOS PARTICIPATING AREA
Effective 3/10/2004 per BLM

Entity From Entity Well API Sec [Twsp |Rng |Q/Q Unit
Eff Date to PA Entity
8/30/2005 12436 to 14864 |WV 10W-1-8-21 4304733794 |01 |080S |210E NWSE |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 112436 to 14864 |WVFU 8W-1-8-21 4304734009 |01 |080S |210E|SENE |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 |12436 to 14864 |WVFU 9W-2-8-21 4304733648 |02 |080S |210E NESE |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 |12436 to 14864 |WVFU 16W-9-8-21 4304733529 |09 |080S |210E|SESE |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 112436 to 14864 |WVFU 15W-9-8-21 4304733661 109 [080S |210E |SWSE |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 12436 to 14864 |WV 2W-10-8-21 4304733655 |10 |080S |210E [NWNE |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 (12436 to 14864 |WV 12W-10-8-21 4304733659 |10 |080S |210E [NWSW |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 12436 to 14864 |WV 15W-10-8-21 4304733916 |10 |080S |210E |SWSE |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 12436 to 14864 |WV 16W-10-8-21 4304734250 |10 |080S |210E |SESE  |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 |12436 to 14864 |WV 14MU-10-8-21 4304735879 |10 |080S |210E|SESW |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 14487 to 14864 |WV 14MU-10-8-21 4304735879 |10 [080S |210E [SESW |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 {12436 to 14864 |WV 4W-11-8-21 4304733657 |11 |080S |210E NWNW |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 12436 to 14864 |WV 6W-11-8-21 4304733906 |11 |080S |210E|[SENW |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 12436 to 14864 |WV 10W-11-8-21 4304733910 |11 |080S |210E [NWSE |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 |12436 to 14864 |WV 13W-11-8-21 4304733913 |11 |080S |210E |SWSW |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 12436 to 14864 |WV 8W-11-8-21 4304733957 |11 |080S |210E|SENE |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 12436 to 14864 |WV 16W-11-8-21 4304734155 |11 |080S |210E[SESE |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 12436 to 14864 |WV 9W-11-8-21 4304734274 |11 |080S |210E NESE |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 14437 to 14864 |WV 14M-11-8-21 4304734280 |11 |080S |210E|SESW |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 12436 to 14864 |WVFU 14 WG 4304733070 |12 |080S |210E[SWSE |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 12436 to 14864 |WVFU 11 WG 4304733085 |12 |080S |210E |SWNE |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 12436 to 14864 |WVFU 1W-12-8-21 4304733531 12 |080S |210E NENE |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 12436 to 14864 |WVFU 9W-12-8-21 4304733534 |12 |080S |210E |NESE |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 [12436to 14864 |WVFU 11W-12-8-21 4304733535 |12 |080S |210E |NESW |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 |12436 to 14864 |WVFU 13W-12-8-21  |4304733537 /12 |080S |210E |SWSW |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 12436 to 14864 |WVFU 8W-12-8-21 4304733862 |12 |080S |210E|SENE |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 |12436 to 14864 |WVFU 10W-12-8-21 4304733863 |12 |080S |210E NWSE |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 |12436to 14864 |WVFU 14W-12-8-21 [4304733864 |12 |080S [210E|SESW |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 |12436 to 14864 |WVFU 16W-12-8-21 4304733865 |12 |080S [210E |SESE |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 [12436 to 14864 |WV 12W-12-8-21 4304734248 |12 |080S |210E NWSW Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 12436 to 14864 |WV 2W-12-8-21 4304734265 |12 |080S |210E [NWNE |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 12436 to 14864 |WV 3W-12-8-21 4304734267 |12 |080S |210E NENW |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 {12436 to 14864 |WV 4W-12-8-21 4304734268 |12 |080S |210ENWNW |Wonsits Valley
8/30/2005 112436 to 14864 |WV 5W-12-8-21 4304734270 |12 |080S |210E SWNW |Wonsits Valley

Page 1
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United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
UT-922

June 28, 2005

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.

Atin: Angela Page

1050 Seventeenth Street, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265

Re: Initial Consolidated
Wasatch-Mesaverde-Mancos Formation PA
Wonsits Valley Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

The Initial Consolidated Wasatch-Mesaverde-Mancos Formation PA, Wonsits Valléy Unit, CRS No.
UTU63043D, AFS No. 891008482D is hereby approved effective as of March 10, 2004, pursuant
to Section 11 of the Wonsits Valley Unit Agreement, Uintah County, Utah.

The Initial Consolidated Wasatch-Mesaverde-Mancos Formation PA results in an Initial Participating
Area of 8,022.50 acres. Copies of the approved request are being distributed to the appropriate
agencies and one copy is returned herewith. Please advise all interested parties of the
establishment of the Initial Consolidated Wasatch-Mesaverde-Mancos Formation PA, Wonsits
Valley Unit, and the effective date. ~

Sincerely,
/s/ Terry Catlin

Terry Catlin
Acting Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure

bee:  Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
SITLA }
Wonsits Valley Unit w/enclosure
Field Manager - Vernal w/enclosure

oy "ECEIVED
Central Files JUL g, 2005

UT922:TATHOMPSON:1t:6/28/05 Div.or oy, GAS & My
G



Division of Qil, Gas and Mining ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1.DJJ
2. CDW
Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 1/1/2007
FROM: (0O1d Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2460-QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. N5085-Questar E&P Company
1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th 8t, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265
Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900 Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900
CA No. Unit: WONSITS YALLEY UNIT
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG|API NO ENTITY |LEASE TYPE|WELL |WELL
NO TYPE | STATUS
SEE ATTACHED LISTS i | *

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

Enter date after each listed item is completed

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 4/19/2007
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 4/16/2007
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 1/31/2005
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5¢c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: n/a
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 4/23/2007 BIA
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 4/23/2007

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BI.M or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on;

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Divigion has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on:

DATA ENTRY:

1. Changes entered in the OQil and Gas Database on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007

4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007

5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007

6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a

BOND VERIFICATION:

1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024 -

2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 799446

3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965003033

3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4, (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS: THIS IS A COMPANY NAME CHANGE.
SOME WELL NAMES HAVE BEEN CHANGED AS REQUESTED

Questar E&P FORM A.xls 4/30/2007 AND 5/15/2007




10f5 QEP Uinta Basin {N2460} to QUESTAR E and P {N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

Original Well Name - |QAQ SEC | TWP | RNG API Entity Lease Well Type |Status
WVU 16 WV 16 NENE 15 | 080S | 210E | 4304715447 | 5265 Federal |WI A
WVU 31 WV 31 NENW 14 | 080S | 210E | 4304715460 | 5265 Federal |WI A
WVU 35 WV 35 NESW 14 : 080S | 210E | 4304715463 | 5265 Federal |WI A
WYV 36 WYV 36 NESW 10 | O80S | 210E | 4304715464 | 5265 Federal |WI A
wWvU 41 WV 41 NENW 15 | 080S | 210E | 4304715469 | 5265 Federal |WI A
WV 43 WV 43 SWSW 11 | 080S | 2Z10E | 4304715471 | 5265 Federal |OW P
WV 48 WV 48 SWNE 10 ! 080S | 210E | 4304715476 | 5265 ‘Federal |OW P
WVU 50 WV 50 SWNE 15 | 080S | 210E | 4304715477 | 5265 Federal |WI A
WV 53 WV 53 SWSE 10 1 080S | 210E | 4304720003 | 5265 iFederal |OW P
WVU 55 WV 55 SWNE 14 | 080S | 210E | 4304720005 @ 5265 |Federal |OW P
WVU 59 WV 59 SWNW 14 | 080S | 210E | 4304720018 © 5265 |Federal |WI A
WVU 60 WV 60 SWSE 15 | 080S | 210E | 4304720019 @ 5265 |Federal |WI A
WV 62 WV 62 SWSW 10 | 080S : 210F | 4304720024 5265 |Federal |OW P
WVU 65 WV 65 SWNW 15 | 0808 ' 210E 4304720041 5265 |Federal |OW P
WVU 67 WV 67 NESW 15 | 0805 " 210E 4304720043 = 5265 |Federal |WI A
WVU 68 WV 68 NESE 15 | 080S 210E 4304720047 ¢ 5265 |Federal |WI A
WVU 83 WV E3I WG NENW 23 | 080S 210E 4304720205 | 14864 |Federal IGW S
WV 97 WV 97 NWSW 11 | 080S 210E = 4304730014 ! 5265 |Federal ‘WI A
WVU 103 WV 103 INWNW 14 | 080S 210E : 4304730021 | 5265 Federal OW P
WVU 104 WV 104 NWNE 15 | 080S , 210E | 4304730022 | 5265 ‘Federat OW P
WV 105 WV 105 SESE 10 | 080S - 210E | 4304730023 | 5265 Federal OW P
WwWvU 109 WV 109 SENE 15 | 080S | 210E | 4304730045 | 5265 Federal .OW P
WvVU 110 WV 110 SENW 14 : 080S | 21C0E | 4304730046 | 5265 Federal [OW P
WV 112 WV 112 SENW 15 - 080S | 210E | 4304730048 | 5265 Federal |OW P
wvU 124 WV 124 NWSE 15 . 080S | 210E | 4304730745 | 5265 Federal |OW P
WVU 126 WV 126 NWNE 21 ' 080S | 210E | 4304730796 | 5265 Federal |WI A
WV 128 WV 128 SESW 10 : 080S | 210E | 4304730798 | 5265 Federal |OW P
WVU 132 WV 132 NWSW 15 ' 080S | 210E | 4304730822 | 5265 Federal |OW P
WVU 136 WV 136 NENW 21  080S | 210E | 4304731047 | 5265 Federal |OW S
WV 137 WV 137 SENW 11 : 080S | 210E | 4304731523 | 5265 :Federal |OW P
WV 28-2 WV 28-2 NESW 11 (80S | 210E | 4304731524 | 99990 |Federal |WI A
WVU 133 WV 133 SESW 15 080S | Z10E | 4304731706 = 5265 |Federal |OW P
WVU 140 WV 140 NWNW 15 . 080S | 210E | 4304731707 5265 |Federal |WI A
WV 40-2 WV 40-2 NESE 10 | 080S | 210E © 4304731798 5265 |Federal ;WI A
WVU 144 WV 144 SENE 10 | O80S | 210E ' 4304731807 5265 |Federal ?OW P
WV 143 WV 143 NWSE . 10 | 080S | 210E 4304731808 5265 |Federal ‘W1 A
WVU 145 WV 145 NWNW ! 18 | 080S  220E 4304731820 ° 14864 |Federal GW P
WVU 121 WV 121 NWSW 14 | 080S 210E 4304731873 | 5265 Federal OW TA
WVU 135-2 WV 135-2 ENENE 21 | 0808 210E 4304732016 | 5265 Federal OW P
WVU 130 WV 130 INWNW | 22 | 080S 210E : 4304732307 | 5265 Federal .OW P
WVU 71-2 WV 71-2 SWSW 15 | 080S 210E | 4304732449 | 5265 Federal |WI A




20f5 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085} 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

Original Well Name E QQ SEC | TWP | RNG API " Entity |Lease Well Type Status
WVEFU 119 WV 119 NWNW 21 | 080S | 210E | 4304732461 5265 |Federal |OW P
WVFU 120 WV 120 NENW 22 | 0808 | 210E | 4304732462 5265 |Federal |WI A
WVFU 54 WG WV 54 WG SWSE 07 | 0B0S | 220E | 4304732821 14864 |Federal |GW P
WVFU 69 WG WV 69 WG SWNE ;, 18 | 080S | 220E | 4304732829 14864 |Federal |GW P
WVFU 38 WG WV 38 WG SWNW | 08 | 080S | 220E | 4304732831 : 14864 |Federal |GW P
WVFU 49 WG WV 49 WG SWSW 08 | 080S | 220E | 4304732832 | 14864 |Federal |GW P
WVFU 138 WG WV 138 WG SWNW | 18 | 080S | 220E | 4304733054 | 14864 |Federal |GW P
WVFU 14 WG WV 14 WG SWSE 12 | 080S | 210E | 4304733070 | 14864 |Federal |GW P
WVFU 11 WG WV 11 WG SWNE 12 | 080S | 210E | 4304733085 | 14864 |Federal |GW P
WVFU 81 WG WV 81 WG SWNW | 24 | 080S | 210E | 4304733086 | 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 146 WG WV 146 WG NWNW | 19 | 0808 ' 220E | 4304733128 | 14864 Federal GW P ]
WVFU 1W-14-8- 21 WV 1W-14-8- 21 NENE 14 | 0805  210E | 4304733220 | 14864 :Federal GW P
WVFU SW-13- 8-21 WV 5W-13- 8-21 SWNW | 13 ! 0808 210E | 4304733221 | 14864 Federal .GW P
WVFU 46 WG WVFU 46 WG NESE 07 ' 080S 220E ' 4304733241 | 14864 Federal |[GW P
WVFU 9W-14-8-21 WV OW-14-8-21 NESE 14 080S : 210E 4304733269 ' 14864 Federal |GW P
WVFU 7W-13-8-21 WV 7W-13-8-21 SWNE 13 080S | 210E 4304733270 14864 |Federal |GW P
WVFU 1W-18-8-22 WV 1W-18-8-22 NENE 18 . 080S | 220E 4304733294 14864 |Federal |GW P |
WVFU 11W-8-8-22 WV 11W-8-8-22 NESW 08 | 080S | 220E | 4304733295 14864 |Federal |GW P
WVFU 3W-8-8-22 PWV 3W-8-8-22 NENW 08 | 080S | 220E | 4304733493 : 14864 |Federal |GW S
WVFU 5W-7-8-22 WV 5W-7-8-22 SWNW 07 | 080S | 220E | 4304733494 . 14864 |Federal |GW P
WVFU 11W-7-8-22 WV 11W-7-8-22 NESW 07 | 080S | 220E | 4304733495 | 14864 |Federal GW P
WVFU 13W-7-8-22 WV 13W-7-8-22 SWSW 07 | 080S | 220E | 4304733496 | 14864 |Federal GW P
WVFU 1W-7-8-22 WV 1W-7-8-22 NENE 07 | 080S | 220E | 4304733501 | 14864 {Federal GW P
WVFU 3W-7-8-22 WV 3W-7-8-22 NENW 07 | 0805 | 220E | 4304733502 | 14864 Federal GW P
WV 7TWRG-7-8-22 WV TWRG-7-8-22 SWNE 07 | 080S | 220E | 4304733503 | 5265 Federal OW P
WVFEU 16W-9-8-21 WV 16W-0-8-21 SESE 09 | 080S | 210E | 4304733529 | 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 1W-12-8-21 WV 1W-12-8-21 NENE 12 | 0805 : 210E | 4304733531 | 14864 Federal .GW P
WVFU 1W-13-8-21 WV 1W-13-8-21 ‘NENE 13 | 0805 210E ! 4304733532 | 14864 Federal [GW P
WVFU 3W-18-8-22 WV 3W-18-8-22 NENW 18 | 0808 220E ' 4304733533 | 14864 Federal |GW P
WVFU 9W-12-8-21 WV 9W-12-8-21 NESE 12 | 080S 210E - 4304733534 | 14864 :Federal |GW P N
WVFU 11W-12-8-21 WV 11W-12-8-21 NESW 12 " 080S : 210E 4304733535 14864 |Federal |GW P
WVFU 11W-13-8-21 WV 11W-13-8-21 NESW 13 080S | 210E 4304733536 14864 |Federal |GW P
WVFU 13W-12-8-21 WV 13W-12-8-21 SWSW 12 0B0S | 210E | 4304733537 14864 |Federal |IGW )
WVFU 13W-18-8-22 WV 13W-18-8-22 SWSW 18 | 080S | 220E | 4304733538 | 14864 |Federal iGW P
WVFU 16G-9-8-21 WV 16G-9-8-21 SESE 09 | 080S | 210E | 4304733565 | 5265 |Federal OW P
WVFU 1W-21-8-21 WV 1W-21-8-21 NENE 21 | 080S | 210E | 4304733602 | 14864 |Federal GW P
WVFU 3W-13-8-21 WV 3W-13-8-21 NENW 13 | 080S | 210E | 4304733603 | 14864 Federal GW S
WVFU 3W-22-8-21 WV 3W-22-8-21 NENW 22 | 0808 : 210E | 4304733604 | 14864 Federal |GW P
WVFU 3W-24-8-21 WV 3W-24-8-21 NENW 24 | 0808 : 210E | 4304733605 | 14864 Federal |GW P
WVFU 13W-13-8-21 WV 13W-13-8-21 SWSW 13 | 0B0S ' 210E | 4304733606 | 14864 Federal |GW S
WVFU 13W-14-8-21 | WV 13W-14-8-21 SWSW 14 | 080S . 210E : 4304733607 | 14864 |Federal |GW P




3of5 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4{30/2007 and 5/15/2007
WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

Original Well Name SEC | TWP | RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status
WVFU 15W-13-8-21 WV 15W-13-8-21 SWSE 13 | 080S | 210E | 4304733608 . 14864 |Federal |GW S
WVFU 1W-24-8-21 WV 1W-24-8-21 NENE 24 | 080S 210E | 4304733613 | 14864 |Federal |GW P
WVFU 11W-18-8-22 WV 11W-18-8-22 NESW 18 | 080S 220E | 4304733626 | 14864 |Federal GW P
WV 2W-10-8-21 WV 2W-10-8-21 NWNE 10 ' 080S , 210E | 4304733655 | 14864 |Federal GW P
WV 4W-11-8-21 WV 4W-11-8-21 NWNW | 11 - 080S | 210E | 4304733657 | 14864 Federal :GW P
WV 12W-10-8-21 WV 12W-10-8-21 NWSW 10 - 080S | 210E 4304733659 | 14864 Federal |GW S ]
WV 12G-10-8-21 WV 12G-10-8-21 NWSW | 10 | 080S | 210E 4304733660 = 5265 Federal |OW P
WVFU 15W-9-8-21 WV 15W-9-8-21 SWSE 09 | 080S | 210E ; 4304733661 14864 jFederal |GW P ]
WVFU 15G-9-8-21 WV 15G-9-8-21 SWSE 09 | 080S ' 2I0E | 4304733662 ; 5265 |Federal |OW P
WVFU 2W-13-8-21 WV 2W-13-8-21 NWNE 13 | 080S 210E | 4304733791 | 14864 |Federal GW P
WVFU 6W-13-8-21 WV 6W-13-8-21 SENW 13 ! 080S ; 210E | 4304733792 | 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 8W-13-8-21 WV §W-13-8-21 SENE 13 080S | 210E | 4304733793 | 14864 Federal GW P |
WV 10W-1-8-21 WV 10W-1-8-21 NWSE 01 ; 080S | 210E 4304733794 14864 Federal |GW TA
WVFU 10W-13-8-21 WV 10W-13-8-21 NWSE L3 | 080S | 210E | 4304733795 14864 [Federal |GW P
WVFU 12W-7-8-22 WV 12W-7-8-22 NWSW | 07 | 080S : 220E | 4304733808 ; 14864 |Federal |GW P
WVFU 6W-8-8-22 WV 6W-8-8-22 SENW 08 | 080S 220E | 4304733811 | 14864 [Federal GW P N
WVFU 7W-8-8-22 WV 7W-8-8-22 SWNE 08 ' 080S  220E | 4304733812 | 14864 'Federal GW S
WVFU 10W-7-8-22 WV 10W-7-8-22 NWSE 07 080S | 220E - 4304733813 | 14864 Federal |GW P
WVFU 12W-8-8-22 WV 12W-8-8-22 NWSW | 08 ; 080S | 220E - 4304733815 14864 :Federal |GW P
WVFU 14W-7-8-22 WV 14W-7-8-22 SESW 07 | O8B0S | 220E ;| 4304733816 14864 |Federal |GW P
WVFU 16W-7-8-22 WV 16W-7-8-22 SESE 07 | 080S ! 220E | 4304733817 | 14864 |Federal GW P
WVFU 6W-7-8-22 WV 6W-7-8-22 SENW 07 | 080S 220E | 4304733828 | 14864 |Federal GW P
WVFU 6W-18-8-22 WYV 6W-18-8-22 SENW 18 | 080S . 220E | 4304733842 | 14864 Federal |GW P
WVFU 6WC-18-8-22 WYV 6WC(C-18-8-22 SENW 18~ 080S | 220E : 4304733843 | 14864 Federal |GW P
WVEU 6WD-18-8-22 WV 6WD-18-8-22 SENW 18 . 080S | 220E 4304733844 ' 14864 :Federal |GW P
WVFU 5W-23-8-21 WV 5W-23-8-21 SWNW | 23  080S | 210E 4304733860 14864 |Federal |GW P
WVFU 7W-23-8-21 WV 7W-23-8-21 SWNE 23 | G80S | 210E | 4304733861 14864 |Federal :GW P |
WVFU §W-12-8-21 WV 8W-12-8-21 SENE 12 | 080S | 210E | 4304733862 | 14864 |Federal GW P
WVFU 10W-12-8-21 WV 10W-12-8-21 NWSE 12 | 080S 210E | 4304733863 | 14864 Federal GW P |
WVFU 14W-12-8-21 WV 14W-12-8-21 |SESW 12 | 080S - 210E | 4304733864 | 14864 Federal |GW P
WVFU 16W-12-8-21 WV 16W-12-8-21 SESE 12 080S | 210E 4304733865 ! 14864 iFederal |GW P
WVFU 1W-15-8-21 WV 1W-15-8-21 NENE 15 ; 080S | 210E ;| 4304733902 14864 |Federal 'GW S
WVFU 1W-22-8-21 WV 1W-22-8-21 NENE 22 | 080S | 210E | 4304733903 | 14864 |Federal GW P
WVFU 1W-23-8-21 WV IW-23-8-21 NENE 23 | 080S - 210E | 4304733904 | 14864 Federal |GW P
WV 6W-11-8-21 WV 6W-11-8-21 SENW 11 | 080S 210E | 4304733906 | 14864 Federal |GW P
WVFU 7W-24-8-21 WV 7W-24-8-21 SWNE 24 " 080S | 210E = 4304733908 ' 14864 iFederal |GW P
WV 10W-11-8-21 WV 10W-11-8-21 NWSE I1 . 080S | 210E 4304733910 14864 |Federal 'GW P
WVFU 11W-15-8-21 WV 11W-15-8-21 NESW 15 | 080S | 210E | 4304733911 | 14864 |Federal GW P
WV 13W-11-8-21 WV 13W-11-8-21 SWSW 11 | 080S | 210E | 4304733913 | 14864 Federal |GW S
WVFU 13W-15-8-21 WV 13W-15-8-21 SWSW 15 | 080S ' 210E | 4304733914 | 14864 Federal |GW P
WV 15W-10-8-21 WV 15W-10-8-21 |SWSE 10 | 080S | 210E | 4304733916 | 14864 |Federal |GW P




40of 5 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P {N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

Original Well Name ; o 0 SEC TWP | RNG API | Entity |Lease Well Type |Status
WVFU 15W-15-8-21 WV 15W-15-8-21 SWSE 15 080S ' 210E | 4304733917 | 14864 |Federal |GW P
WVFU 5W-14-8-21 WV 5W-14-8-21 SWNW | 14  080S " 210E | 4304733953 | 14864 |Federal |GW P
WVFU 7W-14-8-21 WV 7W-14-8-21 SWNE 14 ;. 080S 210E | 4304733955 | 14864 |Federal ‘GW P
WV 8W-11-8-21 WV 8§W-11-8-21 SENE | 11 | 080S ; 210E | 4304733957 ' 14864 'Federal GW S
WVFU 8W-14-8-21 WV 8§W-14-8-21 SENE 14 | 080S | 210E | 4304733958 14864 Federal .GW P
WVFU 9W-15-8-21 WV OW-15-8-21 NESE 15 | 080S | 210E 4304733959 14864 Federal |GW P
WVFU 12W-13-8-21 WV 12W-13-8-21 NWSW 13 | 080S | 210E 4304733961 ; 14864 Federal |GW P
WVFU 14W-13-8-21 WV 14W-13-8-21 SESW 13 | 080S | 210E = 4304733962 | 14864 |Federal |GW P
WVFU 15W-14-8-21 WV I5W-14-8-21 SWSE 14 1 080S | 210E | 4304733963 | 14864 |Federal |GW P
WVFU 2W-18-8-22 WV 2W-18-8-22 NWNE I8  080S ' 220E | 4304733986 | 14864 |Federal |GW P
WV §W-18-8-22 WV 8W-18-8-22 SENE 18  080S 220E | 4304733989 | 14864 |Federal GW P
WVFU 10W-18-8-22 WV 10W-18-8-22 NWSE 18 | 080S . 220E | 4304733991 - 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 12W-18-8-22 WV 12W-18-8-22 NWSW 18 | 080S | 220E = 4304733993 14864 Federal |GW P
WV 14W-18-8-22 WV 14W-18-8-22 SESW 18 | OGS | 220E 4304733995 ; 14864 Federal |GW P
WVFU 8W-1-8-21 WV 8W-1-8-21 SENE 01 | 080S | 210E | 4304734009 | 14864 |Federal |GW DRL
WV 4W-17-8-22 WV 4W-17-8-22 NWNW | 17 0808 : 220E | 4304734038 | 14864 |Federal |GW P
WV 12G-1-8-21 WV 12G-1-8-21 NWSW | 01 0808 ' 210E | 4304734108 | 5265 |Federal 'OW TA
WV 2W-14-8-21 WV 2W-14-8-21 NWNE 14 : 0808 210E | 4304734140 14864 ‘Federal GW P
GH 2W-21-8-21 GH 2W-21-8-21 NWNE 21 | 080S | 210E | 4304734141 14864 Federal |GW P
WV 2W-23-8-21 WV 2W-23-8-21 NWNE 23 | 080S | 210E 4304734142 | 14864 Federal |GW P
GH 3W-21-8-21 WV 3W-21-8-21 NENW 21 | 080S | 210E 4304734143 | 14864 |Federal |GW P
WV 4W-13-8-21 WV 4W-13-8-21 NWNW | 13 | 080S | 210E | 4304734144 | 14864 |Federal |GW P
GH 4W-21-8-21 WV 4W-21-8-21 NWNW | 21 © 0805 | 210E | 4304734145 | 14864 |Federal GW P
WV 4W-22-8-21 WV 4W-22-8-21 NWNW | 22  080S 21i0E | 4304734146 ' 14864 |Federal GW P
WV 16W-11-8-21 WV 16W-11-8-21 :SESE 11 1 O80S . 210E | 4304734155 = 14864 Federal |GW TA
WV 3W-19-8-22 WV 3W-19-8-22 NENW 19 | 080S . 220E | 4304734187 14864 Federal |GW P
WV 4W-23-8-21 WV 4W-23-8-21 NWNW | 23 | G808 | 210E 4304734188 | 14864 Federal |GW P
WV 6W-23-8-21 WV 6W-23-8-21 SENW 23 | 0808 | 210E 4304734189 | 14864 |Federal |GW P
WV 2W-15-8-21 WV 2W-15-8-21 NWNE , 15 | 0808 | 210E | 4304734242 | 14864 |Federal 'GW P
WV 2W-22-8-21 TWV 2W-22-8-21 NWNE | 22 | 080S | 210E | 4304734243 | 14864 |Federal GW P
WV 4W-14-8-21 WV 4W-14-8-21 NWNW | 14  080S : 210E | 4304734244 ' 14864 Federal GW P
WV 6W-12-8-21 WV 6W-12-8-21 SENW 12 . 080S  210E | 4304734245 5265 Federal |GW S
WV 7W-15-8-21 WV 7TW-15-8-21 SWNE 15 | 080S | 210E - 4304734246 | 14864 iFederal |GW P
WV 8W-15-8-21 WV 8W-15-8-21 SENE | 15 | 080S | 210E 4304734247 | 14864 |Federal |GW P
WV 12W-12-8-21 WV 12W-12-8-21 NWSW 12 | 080S | 210E | 4304734248 | 14864 |Federal 'GW -5
WV 14W-15-8-21 WV 14W-15-8-21 SESW 15 | 080S | 210E | 4304734249 | 14864 |Federal GW P
WV 16W-10-8-21 WV 16W-10-8-21 SESE 10 080S | 210E | 4304734250 = 14864 Federal [GW P
WV 16W-15-8-21 WV 16W-15-8-21 SESE 15 . 080S 210E | 4304734251 14864 Federal |GW P
WV 2W-12-8-21 WV 2W-12-8-21 NWNE 12 | 080S | 210E | 4304734265 | 14864 iFederal |GW OPS
WV 3W-12-8-21 WV 3W-12-8-21 NENW 12 | 080S | 210E 4304734267 | 14864 |Federal |GW OPS
WV 4W-12-8-21 WV 4D-12-8-21 NWNW - 12 | 080S | 210E , 4304734268 | 12436 |Federal GW ;DRL




50f5 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

Original Well Name QQ SEC TWP RNG API Entity :Lease Well Type |Status
WV 5W-12-8-21 WV 5W-12-8-21 SWNW © 12 1 080S | 210E | 4304734270 | 14864 |Federal |GW -OPS
WV 6W-14-8-21 WV 6W-14-8-21 SENW 14 | 080S | 210E | 4304734271 ! 14864 |Federal GW P
WV OW-11-8-21 WV IW-11-8-21 NESE 11 | 080S | 210E | 4304734274 ° 14864 |Federal GW DRL
WV 10W-14-8-21 WV 10W-14-8-21 NWSE 14 | 080S | 210E | 4304734275 14864 Federal |GW S
WV 11W-14-8-21 WV 11W-14-8-21 NESW 14 | OBOS | 210E ' 4304734277 ; 14864 Federal |GW P
WV 12W-14-8-21 WV 12W-14-8-21 NWSW 14 | 080S 210E 4304734279 | 14864 {Federal |GW S
WV 14M-11-8-21 WV 14M-11-8-21 SESW 11 080S ; 210E 4304734280 | 14864 |Federal |GW P
WV 14W-14-8-21 WV 14W-14-8-21 ‘SESW 14 080S | 210E | 4304734281 | 14864 |Federal |GW P
WV 16W-14-8-21 WV 16G-14-8-21 SESE - 14 | 0808 | 210E | 4304734283 | 5265 |Federal OW S
WV 3MU-15-8-21 WV 3IMU-15-8-21 NENW 15 | 030S | 210E | 4304734289 14864 'Federal |GW P
WV 4MU-15-8-21 WV 4MU-15-8-21 NWNW i 15 | 080S | 210E | 4304734291 . 14864 Federal |GW P
WV SMU-15-8-21 WV SMU-15-8-21 SWNW 15 | 080S ~ 210E = 4304734293 | 14864 {Federal |GW P
WV 6W-15-8-21 WV 6W-15-8-21 SENW 15 - 080S : 210E 4304734294 | 14864 |Federal |GW P
WV 10W-15-8-21 WV 10W-15-8-21 NWSE 15 . 080S | 210E | 4304734295 | 14864 |Federal -GW P
WVU 4W-24-8-21 WV 4W-24-8-21 NWNW © 24 | 080S | 210E | 4304734330 ' 14864 |Federal GW P
WV 8M-23-8-21 WV 8§M-23-8-21 |SENE 23 | 080S | 210E | 4304734339 14864 Federal |GW P
WVU 8W-24-8-21 WV 8§W-24-8-21 SENE 24 | 0808 | 210E | 4304734340 ; 14864 Federal |GW P
WV 2W-8-8-22 WV 2W-§-8-22 NWNE 08 | 0805 220E 4304734468 | 14864 |Federal |GW P
WV 8§W-7-8-22 WV 8W-7-8-22 SENE 07 0808 | 220E 4304734469 | 14864 |Federal 'GW S
WV 8§W-22-8-21 WV 8W-22-8-21 ‘SENE 22 0808 | 210E | 4304734564 | 14864 |Federal GW P
WV 3G-8-8-22 WV 3G-8-8-22 NENW - 08 | 080S | 220E | 4304734596 = 5265 Federal jOW TA
WV 14MU-10-8-21 WV 14MU-10-8-21 SESW 16 | 0805 | 210E | 4304735879 14864 Federal |GW P N
WV 13MU-10-8-21 WV 13MU-10-8-21 SWSW 10 | 080S ! 210E | 4304736305 | 14864 |Federal |GW P
WYV 3DMIL-13-8-21 WV 3D-13-8-21 SENW 13 | 080S 210E 4304737923 | 14864 |Federal |GW DRL |
WV 14DML-12-8-21 WV 14DML-12-8-21 SESW 12 ; 080S : 210E 4304737924 | 14864 |Federal GW DRL
WV 15AMIE-12-8-21 WV 15AML-12-8-21 NWSE 12 080S | 210E | 4304737925 Federal GW APD
WV 13DML-10-8-21 WV 13DML-10-8-21 SWSW 10 080S | 210E | 4304737926 | 14864 'Federal GW P
WV 4DMIL.-15-8-21 WV 4DML-15-8-21 NWNW | 15 | 080S | 210E | 4304737927 14864 Federal |GW DRL
WV 13AD-8-8-22 WV 13AD-8-8-22 SWSW 08 | 080S | 220E | 4304737945 Federal |GW APD
WV 11AMI.-14-8-21 WV 11AD-14-8-21 NWSE | 14 | 080S ! 210F ! 4304738045 | 15896 |Federal |GW APD |
WV 11DML-14-8-21 WV 11DML-14-8-21 SESW 14 | 080S 210E 4304738050 Federal GW APD
WV 4AML-19-8-22 WV 4AML-19-8-22 NWNW | 19 (080S | 220E | 4304738051 ‘Federal ,GW APD
WV 13CML-8-8-22 WV 13CML-8-8-22 SWSW 08 : 080S | 220E | 4304738431 Federal |GW APD |
WV 13BML-18-8-22 WYV 13BMI1.-18-8-22 [ SWSW 18 | 080S | 220E | 4304738432 Federal |GW APD
WV §BML-18-8-22 ‘WV 8BML-18-8-22 E/NE 18 | O80S ! 220E ' 4304738433 Federal |GW APD
WV 6ML-24-8-21 WYV 6-24-8-21 SENW 24 | 080S 210E 4304738663 Federal GW APD |
WV 2ZML-24-8-21 WYV 2ML-24-8-21 NWNE 24~ 080S j 210E , 4304738664 Federal GW APD
WV IDMIL-13-8-21 WV 1DML-13-8-21 NENE 13 . 080S | 210E | 4304738733 Federal |GW APD
WV 4DML-13-8-21 WV 4DML-13-8-21 NWNW - 13 | 080S | 210E | 4304738734 Federal |GW APD
WYV 3AMIL-14-8-21 WV 3AML-14-8-21 NENW 14 | 080S | 210E | 4304738736 | Federal |GW APD
WV 16CML-14-8-21 WV 16C-14-8-21 SESE | 14 | 080S ' 210E = 4304738737 Federal 'GW APD




10f2 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

Original Well Name = oo SEC TWP RNG | API - Entity [Lease  [Well Type Status
WVU 21 WV 21 NENE 16 | 0O80S i 210E | 4304715452 | 99990 |State WI A
WVU 32 WV 32 NENW 16 | 080S | 210E | 4304716513 | 5265 State oW P
WVU 72 WV 72 SWSW : 16 | 080S | 210E | 4304720058 | 99990 ‘State WI A
WVl 73 WV 73 NESE 16 | 080S | 210E | 4304720066 | 5265 State W1 A
WV 74 WV 74 SWSE 16 | 0805 | 210E | 4304720078 | 5265 State oW P
WVU 75 WV 75 SWNE 16 | 080S | 210E © 4304720085 ' 5265 |State ow P
WVU 78 WV 78 NESW 16 | OB0S | 210E 4304720115 : 99990 |State WI A
WVU 134 WV 134 SESE 16 1 0BOS | 210E 4304731118 5265 |State ow P
WVU 141 WV 141 ‘NWSE 16 © 080S : 210E ; 4304731609 : 5265 |State ow P
WVU 127 WV 127 SENE 16 080S 210E | 4304731611 | 5265 |State ow P
WvVU 142 WV 142 SESW 16 ; 080S : 210E | 4304731612 | 5265 |State oW P
WVFU9IW-13-8-21 WV 9W-13-8-21 NESE 13 | 0808 | 210E | 4304733223 | 14864 ‘State GW S
WVFU 2W-16-8-21 WV 2W-16-8-21 NWNE 16 | 080S | 210F | 4304733246 | 14864 State GwW P
WVFU 2G-16-8-21 WV 2G-16-8-21 NWNE 16 | 0805 | 210E ! 4304733247 | 5265 State OW P
WVFU 6W-16-8-21 WV 6W-16-8-21 SENW - 16 | 080S | 210E 4304733527 14864 |{State GW P
WVFU 6G-16-8-21 WV 6G-16-8-21 SENW {6 | 080S | 210E 4304733564 5265 |State OwW P
WVFU 16W-2-8-21 WV 16W-2-8-21 SESE 02 ° 080S | 210E , 4304733645 - 5265 |State ow S
WVFU OW-2-8-21 WV Ow-2-8-21 NESE 02 080S 210E | 4304733648 | 14864 |State GW P )
WVFU 12W-16-8-21 WV 12W-16-8-21 NWSW 16 . 080S , 210E | 4304733649 | 14864 State GW P
WVFU 12G-16-8-21 WV 12G-16-8-21 NWSW 16 | 080S | 210E | 4304733650 | 5265 State OW P
WVFU 16W-13-8-21 WV 16W-13-8-21 SESE 13 | 080S | 210E | 4304733796 | 14864 State GW P
WV 10G-2-8-21 WV 10G-2-8-21 NWSE 02 | 080S | 2I0E 4304734035 = 5265 :State oW P
WV 14G-2-8-21 WV 14G-2-8-21 SESW 02 | 080S | 210E 4304734036 5265 |State oW P
WV 13G-2-8-21 WV 13G-2-8-21 SWSW ¢ 02 | 0BOS | 210E 4304734068 5265 |State ow P
WV 5G-16-8-21 WV 5G-16-8-21 SWNW | 16 080S D 210E ¢ 4304734107 | 5265 |State oW P
WV 11W-16-8-21 WV 11W-16-8-21 NESW 16  080S ' 210E | 4304734190 | 14864 |State GW p
WV 13W-16-8-21 WV 13W-16-8-21 SWSW 16 0808 210E | 4304734191 | 14864 |State GW P
WV 14W-16-8-21 WV 14W-16-8-21 SESW 16 080S . 210E | 4304734192 | 14864 State GW P
WV 15W-16-8-21 WV 15W-16-8-21 SWSE 16 | 080S i 210E | 4304734224 | 14864 State OW P
WV 16W-16-8-21 WV 16W-16-8-21 SESE 16 | 0BOS | 210E | 4304734225 | 14864 State GW P
WV IMU-16-8-21 WV IMU-16-8-21 NENE 16 | 080S | 210E ° 4304734288 14864 |State oW P
WV 3W-16-8-21 WV 3W-16-8-21 NENW 16 | 080S | 210E 4304734290 State GwW LA
WV 4W-16-8-21 WV 4W-16-8-21 INWNW 16 1 0BOS | 210E . 4304734292 . 12436 |State D PA
WV SW-16-8-21 WV 5W-16-8-21 SWNW 16 0805 210E | 4304734321 | 14864 |State GW P
WV 7TW-16-8-21 WV 7TW-16-8-21 SWNE 16 080S 210E | 4304734322 | 14864 State IGW P
WV 8MIL-16-8-21 WV 8ML-16-8-21 SENE 16 . 080S | 210E | 4304734323 | 14864 State ‘GW rp
WV OW-16-8-21 WV OW-16-8-21 NESE 16 | 0808 | 210E | 4304734325 | 14864 State GW P
WV 10W-16-8-21 WV 10W-16-8-21 NWSE | 16 | 080S | 210E = 4304734326 14864 |State GW P
WV 12BML-16-8-21 WV 12BMIL-16-8-21 SWNW 16 | 080S | 210E 4304737824 14864 |State GW P
WV 12DML-16-8-21 WV 12D-16-8-21 NWSW 16 | 080S | 210E . 4304737870 . State GW APD
WV 15CMI-16-8-21 |WV 15CML-16-8-21 SESW | 16 ! 080S : 210E i 4304737871 | 14864 |State GW P




20f2 QEP Uinta Basin {(N2460) to QUESTAR E and P {N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

Original Well Name fQ I SEC | TWP | RNG API Entity Lease Well Type |Status
WV 15DML-16-8-21 WV 15DML-16-8-21 SWSE | 16 | 080S | 210E | 4304737872 State  |GW APD
WV 16DML-13-8-21 WV 16DML-13-8-21 SESE 13 | 080S | 210E | 4304738735 State | |GW APD




STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER'
see attached
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
see attached
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells bslow current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to see attach ad
drill horizontal aterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. atac
1. TYPE QF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
oLweELL [] GASWELL ] OTHER o

see attached

Z. NAME OF OPERATOR: ! 8. AFI NUMBER.
QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY attached
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: FHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1050 17th Street Suite 500 ., Denver siarg CO 580265 (303) 308-3068
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT sURFAce: attached county: Uintah
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH
11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE QF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[} acioze [] oeeren [T] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
V] NoTICE OF INTENT
(Submitin Duplicate) [ atercasin ] FracTURE TREAT [T] siDETRACK TOREPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start.  [[™]  CASING REPAIR [] wewconsTrRucTiON [C] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
1/1/2007 [1 cHanGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [[] oreraTor cHANGE [] using REPAIR
[} cHanee TuBING [7] PLu AND ABANDON [C] venToRFLARE
(] suBsEQUENT REPORT [] cHaNGE WELL NAME [] PLuGBack [} warer pisposaL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[ chance weLL sTaTus [C] propucTion (sTARTRESUME) [ waTer sHuT-OFF
Date of work complation:

[[] commiNGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE §Z] omer Operator Name
[ convert weLL TYpE [C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Change

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED QR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective January 1, 2007 operator of record, QEP Uinta Basin, Inc., will hereafter be known as QUESTAR EXPLORATION
AND PRODUCTION COMPANY. This name change involves only an internal corporate name change and no third party
change of operator is involved. The same employees will continue to be responsible for operations of the properties described
on the attached list. All operations will continue to be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLM Reference No. ESB000024)

" Utah State Bond Number: 965003033 ’
Fee Land Bond Number: 965003033
Current operator of record, QEP UINTA BASIN, IN
attached list.

hereby r :signs as operator of the properties as described on the

Ja
Successor operator of record, QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANY, hereby assumes all rights, duties
and obligations as operator of the properties as descijgéd on the ditached list

[ ——

Jay B Neese, Executive Vice President
Qtestar Exploration and Production Company

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) _Qeﬁr—a K. ,Stanbe”'ym P e Supervisor, Regulatory Affairs

5 ‘,f
SIGNATURE .([/ MWW—“—-\ oare  3/16/2007

(This space for State use only)

RECEN/ED
APR 1§ 2007

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING.




STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER.
see attached

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Da not use this form for proposals to drill new walls, significantly deapen existing wells beiow current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged walis, or to
dril horizontal laterals Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such praposals,

€. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
see attached

T e i M —
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

see attached

TPEORWELL O e [ easwew [J  OTHER

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
see attached

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:

QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:

attached

PHONE NUMBER:

(303) 308-3068

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR.
o1 CO . 80265

1050 17th Street Suite 500 | ., Denver

10. FIELD AND PQOL, OR WILDCAT

4 LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: aftached

county: Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH
. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE QF ACTION
[] acioize [] oeeren [C] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
[V] NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submitin Duplicate) 1 autercasmg [] rracTure TREAT [T] sioetrack To REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work wil start | [ ] CASING REFAIR [l newconstrucTiON [7] temPoRARILY ABANDON
1/1/2007 [] cHaNGE To PREVIOUS PLANS [T] orerator cHanGE [7] tueine Rerair
[L] cHanGE TuBING [[] PpLuc anp ABaNDON [] ventorFLare
[] suessquenT REPORT [] cHance weLL name [ rweeack [C] waTer pisposaL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[] cHANGE weLL sTATUS [ PropucTION (STARTIRESUME) [[] waTer sHuT-OFF
Date of work comptation:
[[] comminaLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ reciamation oF welL siTe 1 oruer: Well Name Changes
[} converr wew Tvre [] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12.  DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc,
PER THE ATTACHED LIST OF WELLS, QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY REQUESTS THAT THE

INDIVIDUAL WELL NAMES BE UPDATED IN YOUR RECORDS.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Dé(K Stapb'erry P .

e Supervisor, Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATURE //// —J

3t e 41712007

i

{This space for State uae only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

RECEIVED
APR 1.9 2007

DIV OF OIL, GAS ¢ MINING




United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT "
Utah State Office T PRIDE"
P.0. Box 45155 ﬂm&%mﬁ;_
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
uT-922

April 23, 2007

Questar Exploration and Production Company
1050 17th Street, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265

Re: Wonsits Valley Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

On April 12, 2007, we received an indenture dated April 6, 2007, whereby QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
resigned as Unit Operator and Questar Exploration and Production Company was designated as
Successor Unit Operator for the Wonsits Valley Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effective April 23, 2007.
In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the
designated party has obtained all required approval that would entitle it to conduct operations under
the Wonsits Valley Unit Agreement.

Your nationwide oil and gas bond No. ESB000024 will be used to cover all federal operations within
the Wonsits Valley Unit.

Itis requested that you notify all interested parties of the change in unit operator. Copies of the
approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriate federal offices, with one copy returned
herewith,

Sincerely,

/s/ Greg J. Noble

Greg J. Noble
Acting Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals
Enclosure
bee:  Field Manager - Vernal (w/enclosure)
SITLA :

Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
File - Wonsits Valley Unit (w/enclosure)

Agr. Sec. Chron .
Reading File RECEIVED
Central Files

UT922:TAThompson:tt:4/23/07 APR3 O o

WK

Div. OF Ol GRS &




STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

CONFIDENTIAL

FORM 9

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTE TRIBE
Do not use this form f Is to drill Ils, significantly d isting wells bel ent bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t 7. UNIT of GA AGREEMENT NAME:
notu is form for proposals to drill new wells, significan jeepen existing wells oW CUIT lom-hole ae , feenter plu wells, or to
) dm horizontal laterals. UsegAPPLlCATIOr?l FOR PEIgMIT TO DRILL form for such pmposZIs. plueg WONSITS VALLEY
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
oLwelL []  GASWELL /] OTHER WV 3W-12.8-21
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP UINTA BASIN, INC 4304734267
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1571 E. 1700 S. ory VERNAL srare UT - 84078 (435) 781-4032 WONITS VALLEY
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT sURFAcE: 788' FNL 1941' FWL county: UINTAH
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 12 8S 21E STATE:
UTAH
M. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
[0 nNoTICE OF INTENT O U 0]
(Submit in Duplicate) [ Awtercasing [C] frACTURE TREAT [[] sIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: D CASING REPAIR [:] NEW CONSTRUCTION |:| TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[J crance To PREVIOUS PLANS [0 orerator cHangE [ vusing REPAIR
[ cHance TuBING [ pLuG AND ABANDON [ ventorfLaRE
(/] suBSEQUENT REPORT [J cHance weLL NamE [0 reeack [ warer DisPosaL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[[] cHANGE wELL STATUS [C] PRODUCTION (STARTRESUME) [l warersHuT-OFF
Date of work completion:
[[] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [[] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE [} orrer
[C] convert weLL TYPE [C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12,

DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP, Uinta Basin, Inc. set conductor on the WV 3W-12-8-21 on 9/25/03. This location is on Questar's future Drilling schedule.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)_L-aUra Bills e Regulatory Assistant
sowature _ 2 (LA M oare 3/9/2007

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

RECEIVED
MAR 1 2 2007

DIV. OF OlL, GAS & MINING




Form 3160-5

(Aprit 2004) UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

FORM APPROVED
OM B No. 1004-0137
Expires: March 31, 2007
5. Lease Serial No.
UTU 0806

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
Ute Tribe

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side.

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

Gas Well

Waonsits Valley

8. Well Name and No.

L Tvpe o wei Clove — NAL AT
LTI 1N

ITV
2. Name of Operator Questar Exploration and Production Inc.

WwWV3iwi2821
9. API Well No.

3a  Address
1050 17th Street, Suite 500 Denver, CO 80265

3b. Phone No. (include area code)
303 308-3068

43-047-34267
10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R, M., or Survey Description)
788' FNL, 1941' FWL, NENW, Sec 12-T8S-R21E

Wonsits Valley
11. County or Parish, State

Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTKE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
] Acidize L Deepen U Production (StarvResume) LI Water Shut-OFF
Notice of Intent [ Atter Casing Fracture Treat [ Rectamation Well Integrity
| [ cesing Repair New Construction L Recomplete [Zlother DS status extension
Subsequent Report p
M . [J Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon
Final Abandonment Notice D Convert to Injection D Plug Back D Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 31604 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Questar Exploration and Production Company's (QEP) records show that this well was spud on 9/25/03 and 40 feet of 20" conductor has been
set. QEP currently plans to drill this well in 2009 and is currently evaluating the feasibility of drilling the surface casing for this well with a
small rig then coming in with a large drilling rig to drill the rest of the well bore. Based on current data and geologic evaluation, this well will
be drilled to a deeper depth and drilling operations to total depth will require the larger rig. While evaluating the situation for this well, QEP
requests approval to keep this well in DSI status. Paperwork requesting your approval will be submitted to your office in the future providing

detalils of QEP's revised drilling plans for this well.

This sundry is being submitted per the August 23, 2007 written order of the authorized officer received from your office by QEP on August 27,

2007 requesting a time line be provided for when this well will be drilled and completed.

— Arcepted bY 12?  Federal Approval Of This
h t eI f
COPY SENTTON i Lhah Visien © Action Is Necessary
Doe: Il /e 3 oi (an and Mining
Initinly =T : ’ l/ L R: %
i v . : .} " d Al Q o m....a-'l-c y .
14. 1hereby certify that theforegoing is true and 1 N
Nae;;ee ?Ilf:inltfzi/ﬁ ed)oregomgls‘_‘ruean correc R o \ J5 \/V N
Debrx’K. Stapberry ( P / / B Title Supervisor, Regulatory Affairs

s S NS s

10/16/2007

(A g ¢
THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL®R STATE OFFICE USE
Approvedby _ o ___ Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subjectlease | Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make ita crime for any person knowing‘}y and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
ic!

States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2}

0CT 25 2007
DIV.OF OIL, GAS & MINING



APR| Permit Spud Spud Measured Lease
Operator Well Name Number Date Date - Dry Date - Rotary Depth Type
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & WV 5W-12-8-21 4304734270 09/05/01 111/28/01 473 Federal

Operations suspended eff 11/28/2001 at 473 ft; pend geologic eval; accepted by DKD, FED approval necessary. 20071105 OPS ext Accepted by Ut

QUESTAR EXPLORATION & WV 2W-12-8-21 4304734265  09/05/01 11/29/01 473 Federal
Operations suspended eff 11/29/2001 at 473 ft. pend geologic eval; accepted by DKD, FED approval ne?\Sﬁ 20071105 OPS ext Accepted by Ut

708S RA/E S-/2 V!
QUESTAR EXPLORATION& WV 3W-12-8-21 74304734267 | 09/05/01 09/25/03 Federal

03122007 Operations suspended, effetive 03/12/2007; set conductor pipe 40 ft: 20071105 OPS ext Accepted by Ut Dogm, Fed approval necessary:

QUESTAR EXPLORATION & WV 9W-11-8-21 4304734274 09/05/01 09/26/03 40 Federal
20071211 Drilling Reports, Schedule for drilling in 2009: 20071105 Drig ext Accepted by Ut Dogm, Federal approval necessary: 20071211 QOperation

QUESTAR EXPLORATION & RW 23-16B 4304733084  04/08/98 10/17/00 449  State
Operations suspended eff 10/17/2000; surf casing set; pending Geo Eval; apprvd by DKD, 1/14/2002.

QUESTAR EXPLORATION & WV 8W-1-8-21 4304734009  04/10/01 06/16/03 40 Federal
20071211 Drilling Reports, : 20071105 Drilling extension Accepted by Ut Dogm. Fed aproval necessary: 20071211 Operation Suspended eff 11-5-07;

QUESTAR EXPLORATION & QU SG 4W-11-8-22 4304735071 07/02/03 06/11/05 80 Federal
20070209 Driliing reports, Schedule for drilling: 20071105 Conductor chg Accepted by Ut Dogm, Fed approval necessary: 20071211 Operation

QUESTAR EXPLORATION & OU SG 5W-11-8-22 4304735072  07/02/03 06/11/05 80 Federal
20070209 Drilling reports, Schedule for drilling: 20071105 Conductor chg Accepted by Ut Dogm, Fed approval necessary: 20071211 Operation

QUESTAR EXPLORATION & OU SG 14W-11-8-22 4304735114 08/20/03 06/16/05 80 Federal
20070209 Drilling Reports, Schedule for drilling: 20071025 Conductor chg Accepted by Ut Dogm, Fed approval necessary: 20071211 Operation

QUESTAR EXPLORATION & OU SG 13W-11-8-22 4304735377 12/04/03 06/16/05 80 Federal
20070209 Drilling Reports, Schedule for drilling: 20071105 Conductor chg Accepted by Ut Dogm, Federal approval necessary: 20071211 Operation

QUESTAR EXPLORATION & GH 16W-19-8-21 4304735325 10/30/03 06/27/05 80 Federal
20070209 Drilling reports, set conductor on 6-27-05, schedule to drill: 20071105 Conductor chg Accepted by Ut Dogm, Fed approal: 20071211 Operation

QUESTAR EXPLORATION & OU GB 8MU-10-8-22 4304735422 01/08/04 03/22/06 80 Federal
20070209 Drilling Reports, Schedule for drilling: 20071105 Conductor chg Accepted by Ut Dogm, Federal approval necessary: 20071211 Operation

QUESTAR EXPLORATION & RW 22G-09F 4304735656 04/27/04 08/23/06 40 Federal
20060911 Drilling reports,set conductor pipe 40 ft: 03122007 Operations suspended, effective 03/12/2007: 20071105 Conductor chg Accepted by Ut




-

- - CONFIDENTIAL
NOTICE OF LATE REPORTING
DRILLING & COMPLETION INFORMATION

Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-6 states that,
> Operators shall submit monthly status reports for each drilling well (including wells where
drilling operations have been suspended).

Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-21 states that,
> A well is considered completed when the well has been adequately worked to be capable
of producing oil or gas or when well testing as required by the division is concluded.

> Within 30 days after the completion or plugging of a well, the following shall be filed:
» Form 8, Well Completion or Recompletion Report and Log
* A copy of electric and radioactivity logs, if run
* A copy of drillstem test reports,
* A copy of formation water analyses, porosity, permeability or fluid saturation
determinations
A copy of core analyses, and lithologic logs or sample descriptions if compiled
A copy of directional, deviation, and/or measurement-while-drilling survey for
each horizontal well

Failure to submit reports in a timely manner will result in the issuance of a Notice of Violation
by the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, and may result in the Division pursuing enforcement
action as outlined in Rule R649-10, Administrative Procedures, and Section 40-6-11 of the
Utah Code.

As of the mailing of this notice, the division has not received the required reports for

Operator: QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO Today’s Date: 03/03/2008
Well: AP! Number: Drilling Commenced:
List Attached

To avoid compliance action, required reports should be mailed within 7 business days to:
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

If you have questions or concerns regarding this matter, please contact __Carol Daniels
at _(801) 538-5284

Ec: Well File )
. —Compliance File



FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH Nl LIS
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES ‘ Ya
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEAPIBNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTE TRIBE o
Do not use this form for propesals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to 7V3gT’\]’rSCII§ILA§R\E/EAME'\|I_TE’\I¢MBN IT
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. '
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
oLWELL []  GASWELL OTHER WV 3W-12-8-21
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION COMPANY 4304734267
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
11002 E. 17500 S.  ;, VERNAL stare UT 84078 (435) 781-4301 WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 788' FNL. 1941' FWL

county: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 12 8S 21E STATE:
UTAH
M. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[] acioize [[] oeepPen [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
[V] NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submitin Duplicate) ] ALtercasing [[] FrACTURE TREAT [] sievrRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [[] casing REPAR [[] newconsTRucTION [T] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[] CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [] oPERATOR cHanGE ] TuBING REPAIR
[[] cHancETUBING [] PLUG AND ABANDON [] VENTORFLARE
[ susseQueNT REPORT [] cHanGE WELL NAME ] Pueeack ] warer DisposaL
(Submit Original Form Only) ¢
[] cHANGEWELL STATUS [] PrODUCTION (START/RESUME) (] water sHuT-OFF
Date of work completion:
[[] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER: MONTHLY
] CONVERT WELL TYPE [C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION STATUS REPORT

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Exploration & Production Company submits this sundry to report there has been no activity on the above captioned

well since the date of the DSI Status Extension. (October 2007)

RECEIVED
MAR 07 2008
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

Laura Bills

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) TITLE

Associate Regulatory Affairs Analyst

3/6/2008

DATE

SIGNATURE

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

CONFIDENTIAL



Well Name: CWU 1183-10 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 058349

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0
Cum Costs: Drilling $38,000 Completion $0 Well Total $38,000
MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days MW 0.0 Vise 0.0
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION
Start End Hrs  Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 HAULING ROCK ON LOCATION.
11-16-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE
DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0
Cum Costs: Drilling $38,000 Completion $0 Well Total $38,000
MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION
Start End Hrs  Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 HAULING ROCK ON LOCATION.
11-19-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE
DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0
Cum Costs: Drilling $38,000 Completion $0 Well Total $38,000
MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days MW 0.0 Vise 0.0
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION
Start End Hrs  Activity Description

06:00 - 06:00 24.0 PUSHING OUT PIT.
11-20-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE
DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0
Cum Costs: Drilling $38,000 Completion $0 Well Total $38,000
MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTID: 0.0 Perf: PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION
Start End Hrs  Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 PUSHING OUT PIT.
11-21-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE
DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0
Cum Costs: Drilling $38,000 Completion $0 Well Total $38,000
MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days MW 00  Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION
Start End Hrs  Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 PUSHING OUT PIT.
11-26-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE/JERRY BARNES

Page 3



Well Name: CWU 1183-10 Field: CHAPITA DEEP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0
Cum Costs: Drilling $38,000 Completion $0
MD 80 TVD 80 Progress Y Days
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 . Perf :

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION/WO AIR RIG

Property: 058349

Daily Total $0
Well Total $38,000
MW 0.0 Vise 0.0

PKR Depth : 0.0

Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 PUSHING OUT PIT. ROCKY MOUNTAIN DRILLING SPUD A 20" HOLE ON 11/25/07 @ 10:00 PM. SET 60’ OF 14"
CONDUCTOR. CEMENT TO SURFACE WITH READY MIX. JERRY BARNES NOTIFIED CAROL DANIELS
W/UDOGM & MICHAEL LEE W/BLM OF THE SPUD 11/25/07 @ 9:00 PM.
MIRU ROCKY MOUNTAIN DRILLING BUCKET RIG. SPUD WELL @ 10:00 PM, 11/25/2007. DRILLED 20" HOLE
TO 47°. HAD TROUBLE W/HOLE SLUFFING. OPENED HOLE TO 30" & RAN 47’ OF 20" PIPE. MIRU PRO PETRO
CEMENTERS & CEMENTED 20" W/285 SX(58.3 BBLS) PREMIUM CEMENT W/2% CACL2 & Y4 #/ SX FLOCELE.
MIXED CEMENT TO 15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. HOLE FILLED & CIRCULATED 12 BBLS CEMENT TO
PIT.
RAN BACK INSIDE 20" PIPE W/18" TOOLS AND DRILLED TO 80’. SET 80’ OF 14" CONDUCTOR PIPE. MIRU PRO
PETRO CEMENTERS. MIXED & PUMPED 175 SX (36 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT W/2% CACL2 & Y4 #/ SX
FLOCELE. HOLE FILLED & CIRCULATED 5 BBLS CEMENT TO PIT.
JERRY BARNES NOTIFIED MIKE LEE W/BLM & CAROL DANIELS W/ UDOGM OF THE WELL SPUD ON
11/25/2007 @ 9:00 PM.
KAYLENE GARDNER SUBMITTED SUNDRY-TO BLM & RECEIVED VERBAL APPROVAL FOR THE 30" HOLE
AND 20" CASING ON 11/28/2007.
11-27-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE
DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0
Cum Costs: Drilling $38,000 Completion $0 Well Total $38,000
MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LINER READY. WAITING ON LINERS.
11-28-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE
DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0
Cum Costs: Drilling $38,000 Completion $0 Well Total $38,000
MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LINE TODAY.
11-29-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE
DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0
Cum Costs: Drilling $38,000 Completion $0 Well Total $38,000
MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Page 4



Well Name: CWU 1183-10

Field: CHAPITA DEEP

Property: 058349

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perxf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION COMPLETE.
12-11-2007 Reported By JERRY BARNES
DailyCosts: Drilling $317,737 Completion $0 Daily Total $317,737
Cum Costs: Drilling $355,737 Completion $0 ‘ Well Total $355,737
MD 2519  TVD 2,519  Progress 0 Days Y MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: WORT
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU PRO PETRO AIR RIG #9 ON 12/5/2007. DRILLED 12-1/4" HOLE TO 2520’ GL. ENCOUNTERED WATER @

15” & 1680’. RAN 58 JTS (2502.95”) OF 9-5/8", 36.0#/ FT, J-55, ST&C CASING WITH TOP-CO GUIDE SHOE &
FLOAT COLLAR. 8 CENTRALIZERS SPACED MIDDLE OF SHOE JOINT AND EVERY COLLAR TILL GONE.
LANDED @ 2519° KB. RAN 200’ OF 1" PIPE DOWN BACKSIDE. RDMO AIR RIG.

MIRU PRO PETRO CEMENTERS. HELD SAFETY MEETING. PRESSURE TESTED LINES AND CEMENT VALVE
TO 1000 PSIG. PUMPED 195 BBLS FRESH WATER, 20 BBLS GELLED WATER FLUSH AHEAD OF CEMENT.
MIXED & PUMPED 240 SX (163 BBLS) OF PREMIUM LEAD CEMENT W/16% GEL, 10 #/ SX GILSONITE, 3 #/ SX
GR-3, 3% SALT, & % #/ SX FLOCELE. MIXED LEAD CEMENT @ 11 PPG W/YIELD OF 3.82 CF/SX.

TAILED IN W/200 SX (41 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT W/2% CACL2 & Y4 #/ SX FLOCELE. MIXED TAIL
CEMENT @ 15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. DISPLACED CEMENT W/188 BBLS FRESH WATER. BUMPED
PLUG W/1000 # @ 1:25 PM, 12/8/2007. CHECKED FLOAT, FLOAT HELD. SHUT IN CASING VALVE. BROKE
CIRCULATION 185 BBLS INTO FRESH WATER FLUSH. CIRCULATED 30 BBLS OF LEAD CEMENT TO PIT.
CEMENT FELL BACK AT SURFACE WHEN PLUG BUMPED.

TOP JOB # 1: PUMP DOWN 200’ OF 1" PIPE. MIXED & PUMPED 125 SX (25.6 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT
W/4% CACL2 & Y4 #/ SX FLOCELE. MIXED CEMENT @ 15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. HOLE FILLED &
CIRCULATED 6 BBLS LEAD CEMENT

TO PIT. CEMENT FELL BACK WHEN PUMPING STOPPED. WOC 2 HRS.

TOP JOB # 2: MIXED & PUMPED 75 SX (15.3 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT W/4% CACL2 & % #/ SX FLOCELE.
MIXED CEMENT @ 15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. HOLE FILLED & STOOD FULL. RDMO PRO PETRO
CEMENTERS.

PREPARED LOCATION FOR ROTARY RIG. WORT. WILL DROP FROM REPORT UNTIL FURTHER ACTIVITY.

RAN IN HOLE W/STRAIGHT HOLE SURVEY. TAGGED CEMENT @ 2382’. PICKED UP TO 2362’ & TOOK
SURVEY. 2 DEGREE.

KYLAN COOK NOTIFIED JAMIE SPARGER W/BLM OF THE SURFACE CASING & CEMENT JOB ON 12/6/2007
@ 11:00 AM.

01-26-2008 Reported By PINK CHIVERS

DailyCosts: Drilling $29,444 Completion $0 Daily Total $29,444

Cum Costs: Drilling $385,181 Completion $0 Well Total $385,181

MD 2,519 2,519  Progress 0 Days 0 MW 00  Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
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Well Name: CWU 1183-10 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 058349

Activity at Report Time: RIG MOVE

Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 18:00 12.0 R.D.R.T. RIG 100% READY F/ TRUCKS.
FUEL 3300 USED.500.
BOILER 24 HR.

CREW FULL 10 MEN WORK 12 HR.

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS REPORTED.

SAFTY MEETING#1 RIG DOWN. #2 ICY CONDITION

WEATHER FOG. 7 DEG

MOVE RIG TODAY FROM CWU 1177-03. TO CWU 1183-10. 2.1 MILES 1 WAY

01-27-2008 Reported By PINK CHIVERS
DailyCosts: Drilling $16,779 Completion $0 Daily Total $16,779
Cum Costs: Drilling $401,960 Completion $0 Well Total $401,960
MD 2519 TVD 2,519  Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: RIG UP
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 18:00 12.0 R/D & MOVE F/ CWU 1177-03 T/ 1183-10. RIG UP. COMPONENTS ARE SET IN PLACE. RELEASE TRUCKS @
18:00. PLAN TO RAISE DERRICK THIS AM . FINISH RIG UP.
18:00 06:00 12.0 S.D.EN.
FUEL 3100 USED. 200
BOILER 0 HR.

CREW FULL 14 MEN WORK 12 HR.

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS REPORTED.

SAFETY MEETING #1 RIG DOWN. & RIG MOVE. RIG UP. #2 ICY CONDITION
WEATHER FOG. 1 DEG

READY TO TEST B.O.P MONDAY A M

01-28-2008 Reported By PINK CHIVERS
DailyCosts: Drilling $20,285 Completion $0 Daily Total $20,285
Cum Costs: Drilling $422,245 Completion $0 Well Total $422,245
MD 2519  TVD 2,519  Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Vise 0.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: RURT
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 18:00 12.0 RURT. 100% RIG UP.
18:00 06:00 12.0 S.D.EN.
FUEL 2600 USED. 500
BOILER 24 HR.

CREW FULL 15 MEN WORK 12 HR.

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS REPORTED.

SAFTY MEETING#1 RIG DOWN. & RIG MOVE. RIG UP. #2 ICY CONDITION
WEATHER FOG. 8 DEG .

WILL START TESTING @ 9:00. 1/28/08. SPUD 1/28/08
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Weli Name: CWU 1183-10

Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 058349

NOTIFY. JAMIE SPARGER. & CLIFF JOHNSON. B.LM

01-29-2008 Reported By PINK CHIVERS

DailyCosts: Drilling $69,260 Completion $0 Daily Total $69,260

Cum Costs: Drilling $491,505 Completion $0 Well Total $491,505

MD 3,450 3450  Progress 913  Days 1 MW 84  Visc 28.0
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End

06:00

09:00

09:00

13:30

Activity Description

3.0 NIPPLE UP B.O.P. RIG ON DAY WORK 1/28/09 @ 6:00 HRS.

4.5 SAFTY MEETING.RIG UP B&C QUICK TEST, TEST BOP’S AS FOLLOWS. TESTER JESSIS PINCE.: TESTED

UPPER & LOWER KELLY VALVE, INSIDE BOP & SAFETY VALVE TO 250 PSI LOW FOR 5 MINUTES & 5000 PSI
HIGH FOR 10 MINUTES. TESTED PIPE RAMS & INSIDE BOP VALVES TO 250 PSI LOW FOR 5 MINUTES & 5000
PSI HIGH FOR 10 MINUTES. TESTED PIPE RAMS & OUTSIDE BOP VALVES TO 250 PSI LOW FOR 5 MINUTES
& 5000 PSI HIGH FOR 10 MINUTES. TESTED PIPE:RAMS, CHECK VALVE, CHOKE LINE, INSIDE MANIFOLD
VALVES & UPRIGHT GAUGE VALVE TO 250 PSI LOW FOR 5 MINUTES & 5000 PSI HIGH FOR 10 MINUTES.
TESTED ANNULAR TO 250 PSTLOW FOR 5 MINUTES & 2500 PSI HIGH FOR 10 MINUTES. TESTED BLIND
RAMS, CHOKE LINE & MANIFOLD VALVES TO 250 PSI LOW FOR 5 MINUTES & 5000 PSI HIGH FOR 10
MINUTES. TESTED BLIND RAMS, CHOKE LINE & SUPERCHOKE TO 250 PSI LOW FOR 5 MINUTES & 5000 PSI
HIGH FOR 10 MINUTES. TESTED SURFACE CASING TO 1500 PSI FOR 30 MINUTES, RUN ACCUMULATOR

TEST. OK.
BLM DID NOT WITNESS TEST.
0.5 INSTALL WEAR BUSHING.
3.0 PU/LD BHA & TOOLS.
2.5 DRILL CEMENT/FLOAT EQUIP.TAG CMT @ 2416’

13:30 14:00
14:00 17:00
17:00 19:30
19:30 20:00
20:00 20:30
20:30 21:00
21:00 06:00

0.5 CIRC & FIT TEST 360 PSI EMW 11#
0.5 SURVEY @ 2480’ 1.88 DEG.

VIS 28.

FUEL 8800 USED. 1800 REC 8000 GAL @ $ 3.25
BOILER 24 HR.

CREW FULL 10 MEN WORK 12 HR.

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS REPORTED.

0.5 DRLG F/ 2537° T/ 2547’ 10’ @ 20FPH WOB 15 ROTARY 55 MOTOR 73 #1 PUMP 130 SPM 455 GPM.

9.0 DRLG F/ 2547 T/ 3450’ 913’ @101.4 FPH. WOB 16/18 ROTARY 55. MOTOR.73 #1 PUMP 130.SPM.455 GPM WT 8.4

SAFTY MEETING#1 PRESSURE TESTING. #2 CONNECTIONS. MORNING TOUR BOP DRILL 1 MIN 2 SEC.

WEATHER FOG. -2 BELOW .

FORMATION TOP.

GREEN RIVER. 1868’

LITHOLOGY.SH.70% SS.20%. LIMESTONE.10%.
SHOW.

2605°-2630. 2804’-2867°. 2873’-2921°. 2982’-3033’
MUD LOGER. JOE TISSAW. 1 DAY ON LOCATION.
WT 85 VIS 28

06:00 18.0 SPUD 8 7/8" HOLE @ 21:00 HRS, 1/28/08.

01-30-2008 Reported By PINK CHIVERS / PETE COMEAU
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Well Name: CWU 1183-10 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 058349

DailyCosts: Drilling $104,999 Completion $0 Daily Total $104,999
Cum Costs: Drilling $596,504 Completion $0 Well Total $596,504
MD 5220 TVD 5220  Progress 1,770 Days 2 MW 8.9 Visc 28.0
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRLG @ 5220°
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 06:30 0.5 DRLG F/ 3450’ T/ 3563’ 113’ @ 226’ FPH.WOB 16/18. ROTARY 55. MOTOR 73#1 PUMP 130SPM 455 GPM.
06:30 07:00 0.5 SURVEY @ 3480’ 1.07DEG.
07:00 08:00 1.0 DRLG F/ 3563’ T/ 3658’. 95’ @ 95 FPH. SAME AS ABOVE.
08:00 08:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE.FUNCTION C.O.M & HCR. B.O.P DRILL 1 MIN 1 SEC.
08:30 09:00 0.5 RIG REPAIR. WELD GATE ON MUD TANK.
09:00 00:00 15.0 DRLG F/3658’ T/ 4865° 1207’ @80.5 FPH. WOB 16/18 ROTARY 55. MOTOR 73. # 1 PUMP 130 SPM. 455 GPM. WT
9.3 VIS 30.
00:00 00:30 0.5 SURVEY @4895’ 2.09 DEG.
00:30 06:00 5.5 DRILG F/4865° T/ 5220’ 355’ @ 64.5 FPH. WOB 17/19. ROTARY 55 MOTOR 73. # 1 PUMP 130 SPM. 455 GPM. WT
9.4. VIS 30.
FUEL 7000 USED. 1800
BOILER 24 HR.

CREW FULL 10 MEN WORK 12 HR.

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS REPORTED.

SAFTY MEETING#1 WIRE LINE SURVEY . #2 CROWN SAVER
WEATHER FOG. 6 DEG.

FORMATION TOP.

GREEN RIVER. 1868’

WASATH. 4935

LITHOLOGY.SH.20% RED SH.40%. SS.40%.

BG GAS—89. CONN 839.

SHOW.3957°—4037" 4053°—4130°. 4253°-4351". 4386°-4433’. 4489°—4525" 4693°—4818" 4926’-4944’
MUD LOGER. JOE TISSAW. 2 DAY ON LOCATION.

WT 9.4 VIS 30
01-31-2008 Reported By PETE COMEAU
DailyCosts: Drilling $35,155 Completion $0 Daily Total $35,155
Cum Costs: Drilling - $631,660 Completion $0 Well Total $631,660
MD 6,150 TVD 6,150  Progress 930  Days 3 MW 95 Visc 30.0
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 6150
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 13:00 7.0 DRILL 8.75" HOLE FROM 5220 TO 5542. 322’ @ 46 FPH. WOB 18, RPM 55 & MOTOR 73. #1 PUMP ON HOLE @
130 SPM. 455 GPM @ 1800 PSI. MUD WT 9.7 & VIS 31
13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION CROWN O MATIC & PIPE RAMS
13:30 06:00 16.5 DRILL 8.75" HOLE FROM 5542 TO 6150, 608’ @ 37 FPH. WOB 18, ROTARY 55 & MOTOR 73. #1 PUMP ON HOLE

@ 130 SPM, 455 GPM @ 1900 PSI. MUD WT 10.0 & VIS 32.

BGG GAS = 108, CONN GAS = 3249, HIGH GAS = 8751 @ 6069

LITHOLOGY = SH = 50%. SS =30%. RED SH =20%

SHOWS: (5205 ~ 5230) ( 5507 — 5517) ( 5662 — 5679) ( 5696 — 5738) ( 5821 — 5882) ( 5942 — 5977) ( 6043 — 6076)
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Well Name: CWU 1183-10 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 058349

FORMATION TOPS: CHAPITA WELLS @ 5514

MUD LOGGER JOE TISSAW ON LOCATION 3 DAY'S ON LOCATION
FUEL 4900, USED 2100

CREWS FULL, NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS REPORTED
SAFETY MEETINGS: #1 = WIRE LINE SURVEYS, #2 = PUMP REPAIR

BOILER RAN 24 HRS
WEATHER -6 DEGREES
02-01-2008 Reported By PETE COMEAU
DailyCosts: Drilling $44,213 Completion $647 Daily Total $44,860
Cum Costs: Drilling $675,873 Completion $647 Well Total $676,520
MD 6296 TVD 6,296  Progress 146 Days 4 MW 100 Vise 320
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: RIG REPAIR / 6296’
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 09:30 3.5 DRILL 8.75" HOLE FROM 6150 TO 6233. 83° @ 23 FPH. WOB 18, ROTARY 55 & MOTOR 73. #1 PUMP ON HOLE @
130 SPM, 455 GPM @ 1900 PSI. MUD WT 10.0 & VIS 33
09:30 10:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION CROWN O MATIC & SAFETY VALVES
10:00 12:30 2.5 DRILL 8.75" HOLE FROM 6233 TO 6296. 63’ @ 25 FPH. WOB 18, ROTARY 55 & MOTOR 73. #1 PUMP ON HOLE @
130 SPM. 455 GPM @ 1900 PSI. MUD WT 10.0 & VIS 33. ( NOTE: #2 FLOOR MOTOR FAILED)
12:30 15:00 2.5 CIRCULATE, CONDITION MUD FOR TRIP TO CASING SHOE
15:00 17:00 2.0 TRIP OUT TO CASING SHOE TO CHANGE FLOOR MOTOR
17:00 06:00 13.0 RIG REPAIR. WAIT ON MOTOR FROM CASPER

BGG GAS = 146, CONN GAS = 348, HIGH GAS = 269

LITHOLOGY, RED SH = 40%, SH = 40%, SS = 20%

NO SHOWS

FORMATION TOPS: BUCK CANYON @ 6189

MUD LOGGER JOE TISSAW ON LOCATION 4 DAYS

FUEL 3400, USED 1500

CREWS FULL, NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS REPORTED

SAFETY MEETING #1 = PPE, #2 = CHANGEING OIL

WEATHER + 10 DEGREES

MOTOR EXPECTED TODAY BEFORE NOON. CRANE WILL ARRIVE @ 09:00

06:00 18.0
02-02-2008 Reported By PETE COMEAU
DailyCosts: Drilling $61,731 Completion $4.585 Daily Total $66,316
Cum Ceosts: Drilling $737,605 Completion $5.232 Well Total $742,837
MD 6296 TVD 6,296  Progress 0 Days 5 MW 102 Visc 36.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf: PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: RIG REPAIR / MAIN FLOOR MOTOR
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RIG REPAIR REMOVE FLOOR MOTOR #2. WAIT ON MOTOR FROM CASPER

FUEL 9600, USED 1800, RECIEVED 8000
CREWS FULL, NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS REPORTED
SAFETY MEETINGS: #1 = CRANE WORK, #2 = ICEY CONDITIONS
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Well Name: CWU 1183-10 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 058349

WEATHER -1 DEGREE
MUD LOGGER JOE TISSAW ON LOCATION 5 DAYS

02-03-2008 Reported By PETE COMEAU
DailyCosts: Drilling $35,747 Completion $0 Daily Total $35,747
Cum Costs: Drilling $773,352 Completion $5,232 Well Total $778,584
MD 6365 TVD 6,365  Progress 69 Days 6 MW 102 Vise 36.0
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 6365
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 21:30 15.5 RIG REPAIR. MOTOR ARRIVED ON LOCATION @ 12:30. CHANGE OUT #2 FLOOR ENGINE
21:30 22:00 0.5 CIRCULATE PUMP SLUG FOR TRIP
22:00 00:00 2.0 TRIP OUT FROM SHOE FOR BIT CHANGE
00:00 00:30 0.5 LAY DOWN REAMERS, CHANGE OUT MUD MOTOR & BIT
00:30 03:00 2.5 TRIP IN HOLE TO 6200°. HOLE IN GOOD CONDITION
03:00 03:30 0.5 WASH 92’ TO BOTTOM, 5’ FILL
03:30 06:00 2.5 DRILL 8.75" HOLE FROM 6292 —6365’. WOB 19, ROTARY 53 & MOTOR 70. #1 PUMP ON HOLE @ 125 SPM.

438 GPM @ 1900 PSI. MUD WT 10.2 & VIS 33

FUEL 7800, USED 1800

CREWS FULL,

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS REPORTED

SAFETY MEETINGS, #1 = CRANE SAFETY, #2 = BOILER
WEATHER +7 DEGREES

BGG GAS =177, TRIP GAS =2463 @ 6296

MUD LOGGER JOE TISSAW ON LOCATION 6 DAYS

06:00 18.0
02-04-2008 Reported By PETE COMEAU
DailyCosts: Drilling $27,992 Completion $0 Daily Total $27,992
Cum Costs: Drilling $801,345 Completion $5,232 Well Total $806,577
MD 6,930 TVD 6,930  Progress 565 Days 7 MW 104 Visc 34.0
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 6930
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL 8.75" HOLE FROM 6365 TO 6536, 171’ @ 34 FPH. WOB 18, ROTARY 53 & MOTOR 70. #1 PUMP ON HOLE
@ 125 SPM. 438 GPM @ 1750 PSI. MUD WT 10.4 & VIS 34
11:00 11:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION CROWN O MATIC & HCR
11:30 06:00 18.5 DRILL 8.75" HOLE FROM 6536 TO 6930. 394,@ 21 FPH. WOB 22/24, ROTARY 52 % MOTOR 65. #2 PUMP ON

HOLE @ 127 SPM. 407 GPM @ 1650 PSI. MUD WT 10.6 & VIS 36.

BGG GAS = 84, CONN GAS = 130, DOWNTIME GAS = 838, HIGH GAS =760 @ 6304
LITHOLOGY:SS =60%, SH = 30%, RED SH 10%

FORMATION TOPS, NORTH HORN 6840

NO SHOWS

MUD LOGGER JOE TISSAW ON LOCATION 7 DAYS

FUEL 6100, USED 1700

CREWS FULL, NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS REPORTED
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Well Name: CWU 1183-10 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 058349

SAFETY MEETINGS. #1 = PUMP REPAIR, #2 = PINCH POINTS

BOILER RAN 24 HRS
WEATHER: +11 DEGREES
02-05-2008 Reported By PETE COMEAU
DailyCosts: Drilling $38,590 Completion $0 Daily Total $38,590
Cum Costs: Drilling $839,935 Completion $5,232 Well Total $845,167
- MD 7,300  TVD 7,300 Progress 370 Days 8 MW 106 Visc 36.0
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 7300
Start End Hrs  Activity Description ‘
06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILLDRILL 8.75" HOLE FROM 6930 TO 7005. 75" @ 15 FPH, WOB 20/24, ROTARY 52 & MOTOR 65M #2 PUMP
ON HOLE @ 127 SPM, 407 GPM @ 1650 PSI. MUD WT 10.6 & VIS 35
11:00 11:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION CROWN O MATIC & SAFETY VALVES
11:30 18:30 7.0 DRILL 8.75" HOLE FROM 7005 TO 7129. WOB 24 , ROTARY 52 & MOTOR 71. #1 PUMP ON HOLE @ 127 SPM. 444
GPM @ 1850 PSI.. MUD WT 10.8 & VIS 35. LOST COMPLETE RETURNS @ 7129
18:30 20:00 1.5 MIX & PUMP 60 BBL LCM SWEEP, GAIN RETURNS, TRANSFER MUD FROM PREMIX, BUILD VOLUME. LOST
TOTAL 160 BBLS MUD.
20:00 06:00 10.0 DRILL 8.75" HOLE FROM 7129 TO 7300. 171’ @ 17.1 FPH. WOB 24, ROTARY 51 & MOTOR 67. #1 PUMP ON HOLE

@ 120 SPM, 420 GPM @ 1850 PSI. MUD WT 10.9 & VIS 35.

BGG GAS =73, CONN GAS = 128, DOWNTIME GAS = 1214, HIGH GAS = 1488 @ 7206
LITHOLOGY: SS = 50%. SH — 40%, RED SH — 10%, SLTSTN TR

SHOWS: 7203 - 7212

MUD LOGGER JOE TISSAW ON LOCATIONS DAYS.

FUEL 4200, USED 1900

CREWS FULL, NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS REPORTED

SAFETY MEETINGS: #1 = 100% TIE OFF. #2 = MIXING MUD

WEATHER -1 DEGREES

02-06-2008 Reported By PETE COMEAU
DailyCosts: Drilling $63,694 Completion $0 Daily Total $63,694
Cum Costs: Drilling $903,630 Completion $5,232 Well Total $908,862
MD 7615 TVD 7,615  Progress 315 Days 9 MW 1.0 Vise 36.0
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 7615
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 13:30 7.5 DRILL 8.75" HOLE FROM 7300 TO 7414. 114’ @ 15 FPH. WOB 24, ROTARY 51 & MOTOR 67. #1 PUMP @ 120
SPM. 420 GPM @ 1800 PSI. MUD WT 10.9 & VIS 37
13:30 14:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION CROWM O MATIC & PIPE RAMS.
14:00 06:00 16.0 DRILL 8.75" HOLE FROM 7414 TO 7615. 201’ @ 12 FPH. WOB 24, ROTARY 51 & MOTOR 67. #1 PUMP @ 120

SPM, 420 GPM @ 1850 PSI. MUD WT 11.0 & VIS 37.

BGG GAS = 101, CONN GAS = 3092, HIGH GAS = 3742 @ 7581
LITHOLOGY: SS =40%, SH = 40%, SLTSTN = 20%, CARB SH = TR
SHOWS = ( 7456 — 7472) 7541 — 75 83)

FORMATION TOPS. KMV PRICE RIVER @ 7456

MUD LOGGER JOE TISSAW ON LOCATION 9 DAYS

FUEL 10,200. USED 2000, RECIEVED 8000
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Well Name: CWU 1183-10 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 058349

CREWS FULL, NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS REPORTED
SAFETY MEETINGS, #1 = STEAM, #2 = AIR HOISTS
WEATHER - 6 DEGREES

BOILER RAN 24 HRS
02--07-2008 Reported By PETE COMEAU
DailyCosts: Drilling $42,344 Completion $0 Daily Total $42,344
Cum Costs: Drilling $945,975 Completion $5,232 Well Total $951,207
MD 7,755 TVD 7,755 Progress 140 Days 10 MW 110 Yisc 40.0
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 7755
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 10:00 4.0 DRIl 8.75" hole from 7615 to 7658. 43’ @ 11 FPH. WOB 24, ROTARY 51 & MOTOR 67. #1 PUMP ON HOLE @ 120
SPM. 420 GPM @ 1850 PSI. MUD WT 11.0 & VIS 40
10:00 11:30 1.5 CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN FOR BIT TRIP
11:30 12:00 0.5 PUMP SLUG & SURVEY
12:00 15:00 3.0 TRIP OUT FOR BIT. FUNCTION CROWN O MATIC WITH DRILL LINE ON FIRST STAND. HOLE IN GOOD
CONDITION
15:00 15:30 0.5 CHANGE OUT MUD MOTOR & CHANGE BITS
15:30 19:00 3.5 TRIP IN WITH BIT # 3. FUNCTION CROWN O MATIC ON FIRST STAND. FILL PIPE @ 4500’
19:00 20:00 1.0 BREAK CIRCULATION, WASH FROM 7600 TO 7658, 5’ FILL
20:00 06:00 10.0 DRILL 8.75" HOLE FROM 7658 TO 7755. 97° @ 9.7 FPH. WOB 24, ROTARY 50 & MOTOR 67. #1 PUMP @ 120 SPM,

420 GPM @ 1825 PSI. MUD WT, 11.2 & VIS 39

BGG GAS =95, CONN GAS = 106, TRIP GAS = 3813, HIGH GAS = 3741 @ 7581
LITHOLOGY: SH = 60%, SS =20%, SLTSTN = 20%, CARB SH =TR

SHOWS: (7456 — 7472) ( 7541 — 7583)

MUD LOGGER JOE TISSAW ON LOCATION 10 DAYS

FUEL 8400, USED 1800

CREWS FULL, NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS REPORTED

SAFETY MEETINGS: #1 = TRIPPING, #2 = TRIPPING

BOILER RAN 24 HRS
WEATHER -9 DEGREED
02-08-2008 Reported By PETE COMEAU
DailyCosts: Drilling $32,095 Completion $594 Daily Total $32,689
Cum Costs: Drilling $978,070 Completion $5,826 Well Total $983,896
MD 8,000 TVD 8,000  Progress 245 Days 11 MW 11.2 Visc 36.0
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 8000
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 10:00 4.0 DRILL 8.75" HOLE FROM 7755 TO 7791. 36’ @ 9 FPH. WOB 24. ROTARY 51 & MOTOR 70, #1 PUMP ON HOLE @
125 SPM, 437 GPM @ 1950 PSIL. MUD WT 11.2 & VIS 37.
10:00 10:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION CROWN O MATIC & SUPERCHOKE
10:30 06:00 19.5 DRILL 8.75" HOLE FROM 7791 TO 8000, 209" @ 10.7 FPH. WOB 24. ROTARY 33/50. MOTOR 70. #1 PUMP ON

HOLE @ 125 SPM, 437 GPM @ 1950 PSI. MUD WT 11.2 & VIS 37.
BGG GAS = 145, CONN GAS = 2153, HIGH GAS = 4402 @ 7893
LITHOLOGY: SH = 40%, SS = 30% CARB SH = 20% SLTSTN = 10%
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Well Name: CWU 1183-10 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 058349

SHOWS: (7819 — 7844) ( 7870 — 7904) ( 7913 — 7956)

MUD LOGGER JOE TISSAW ON LOCATION 11 DAYS

FUEL 6200, USED 2200

CREWS FULL, NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS REPORTED
SAFETY MEETINGS: #1 = WORKING ON PUMP CLUTCH. #2 = PPE

BOILER RAN 24 HRS
WEATHER: -7 DEGREES
02--09-2008 Reported By PETE COMEAU
DailyCosts: Drilling $40,814 Completion $1,047 Daily Total $41,861
Cum Costs: Drilling $1,018,884 Completion $6.873 Well Total $1,025,757
MD 8205 TVD 8205  Progress 205 Days 12 MW 1.1 Visc 39.0
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 8205’
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL 8.75" HOLE FROM 8000’ TO 8047°. 47° @ 9.4 FPH. ( TD FOR 8.75" HOLE) WOB 24, ROTARY 53 & MOTOR
70. #1 PUMP ON HOLE @ 125 SPM. 437 GPM @ 1850 PSI. MUD WT 11.2 & VIS 39.
11:00 12:00 1.0 CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN FOR BIT TRIP
12:00 12:30 0.5 PUMP SLUG & SURVEY
12:30 16:00 3.5 TRIP FOR BIT TO REDUCE HOLE SIZE, FUNCTION CROWN O MATIC WITH DRILL LINE ON FIRST STAND.
16:00 16:30 0.5 CHANGE OUT MOTOR & BITS
16:30 19:30 3.0 TRIP IN HOLE WITH BIT # 4. FILL PIPE @ 4200’. HOLE IN GOOD CONDITION
19:30 20:00 0.5 BREAK CIRCULATION, WASH FROM 7990 TO 8047, NO FILL ON BOTTOM
20:00 06:00 10.0 DRILL 7.875" HOLE FROM 8047 TO 8205°. 158’ @ 15.8 FPH WOB 18/20, ROTARY 50 & MOTOR 67. #1 PUMP ON

HOLE @ 120 SPM. 420 GPM @ 2100 PSI. MUD WT 11.2 & VIS 35

BGG GAS = 139, CONN GAS = 1429, TRIP GAS =952, HIGH GAS = 1040 @ 8105
LITHOLOGY: SH = 50%, SS=20% CARB SH = 20% , SLTSTN 10%

NO SHOWS

MUD LOGGER JOE TISSAW ON LOCATION 12 DAYS

FUEL 4300, USED 1900

CREWS FULL, NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS REPORTED

SAFETY MEETINGS: #1 = AIR TUGGER, #2 = TRIPPING

BOILER RAN 24 HRS

WEATHER: CLEAR, +7 DEGREES

02-10-2008 Reported By PETE COMEAU
DailyCosts: Drilling $32,108 Completion $878 Daily Total $32,986
Cum Costs: Drilling $1,050,992 Completion $7,751 Well Total $1,058,743
MD 8,692 TVD 8,692 Progress 487 Days 13 MW 11.2 Visc 35.0
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 8692’
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 08:30 2.5 DRILL 7.875" HOLE FROM 8205 TO 8260. 55’ @ 22 FPH. WOB 18. ROTARY 51 & MOTOR 67. #1 PUMP ON HOLE
@ 120 SPM, 420 GPM @ 1950 PSI. MUD WT 11.2 & VIS 35
08:30 09:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION CROWN O MATIC & HCR
09:00 06:00 21.0 DRILL 7.875" HOLE FROM 8260 TO 8692. 432’ @ 20 FPH. WOB 19, ROTARY 50 & MOTOR 67. #1 PUMP ON HOLE

@ 120 SPM. 420 GPM @ 2150 PSI. MUD WT 11.4 & VIS 36.
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Well Name: CWU 1183-10 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 058349

BGG GAS =151, CONN GAS = 1033, HIGH GAS = 3795 @ 8458

LITHOLOGY: CARB SH = 50% SS = 20% SLTSTN 20% SH = 10%

FORMATION TOPS: KMV PRICE RIVER MIDDLE @ 8334

SHOWS: ( 8196 — 8248) ( 8322 - 8461)

MUD LOGGER JOE TISSAW ON LOCATION 13 DAYS

FUEL 2300, USED 2000

CREWS FULL, NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS REPORTED

SAFETY MEETINGS: CHANGEING TONG DIES, #2, INSPECTING SNUB LINES

BOILER RAN 24 HRS
02-11-2008 - Reported By PETE COMEAU
DailyCosts: Drilling $75,088 Completion $1,067 Daily Total $76,155
Cum Costs: Drilling $1,126,081 Completion $8,818 Well Total $1,134,899
MD 8,910 TVD 8910  Progress 218 Days 14 MW 114 Visc 37.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: TIH W/NEW BIT
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 14:00 8.0 DRILL 7.875" HOLE FROM 8692 TO 8826. 134’ @ 16 FPH. WOM 18/20. ROTARY 50 & MOTOR 67. #1 PUMP ON
HOLE @ 120 SPM. 420 GPM @ 1950 PSI. MUD WT 11.4 & VIS 37
14:.00 14:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION CROWN O MATIC & SUPERCHOKE
14:30 00:00 9.5 DRILL 7.875" HOLE FROM 8826 TO 8910. 84’ @ 8.8 FPH. WOB 18/22. ROTARY 50 & MOTOR 67. #1 PUMP ON
HOLE @ 120 SPM. 420 GPM @ 1950 PSI. MUD WT 11.4 & VIS 36.
00:00 01:00 1.0 CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN FOR BIT TRIP
01:00 01:30 0.5 PUMP SLUG, SURVEY, BLOW KELLY
01:30 04:30 3.0 TRIP OUT FOR BIT CHANGE, FUNCTION CROWN O MATIC ON FIRST STAND . HOLE IN GOOD CONDITION
04:30 05:00 0.5 CHANGE OUT MOTOR & BITS
05:00 06:00 1.0 TRIP IN HOLE WITH BIT # 5. FUNCTION CROWN O MATIC ON FIRST STAND

BGG GAS =265, CONN GAS = 1739, HIGH GAS = 3648 @ 8798
LITHOLOGY: SH = 50%, CARB SH 20%, SLTSTN 25%, SS = 10%
SHOWS: 8791 = 8867

MUD LOGGER JOE TISSAW ON LOCATION 14 DAYS

FUEL 8400, USED 1900, RECIEVED 8000

CREWS FULL, NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS REPORTED
SAFETY MEETINGS: #1 = PP-E, #2 = TEAMWORK

BOILER RAN 24 HRS
WEATHER + 4 DEGREES
02-12-2008 Reported By PETE COMEAU
DailyCosts: Drilling $33,501 Completion $972 Daily Total $34,473
Cum Costs: Drilling $1,159,583 Completion $9,790 Well Total $1,169,373
MD 9275 TVD 9275  Progress 365 Days 15 MW 11.6 Visc 38.0
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 9275
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE, FUNCTION PIPE RAMS
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Well Name: CWU 1183-10 . Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 058349

07:00 09:30 2.5 FINISH TRIP IN HOLE. RESET CROWN O MATIC & FUNCTION WITH DRILL LINE ON FIRST STAND. HOLE IN
GOOD CONDITION.

09:30 10:00 0.5 BREAK CIRCULATION. WASH & REAM 68’ TO BOTTOM, NO FILL

10:00 16:30 6.5 DRILL 7.875" HOLE FROM 8910 TO 8981. 71 @ 10.9 FPH. WOB 16/18. ROTARY 51 & MOTOR 67. #1 PUMP ON
HOLE @ 120 SPM. 420 GPM @ 2000 PSI. MUD WT 11.5 & VIS 36

16:30 17:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION CROWN O MATIC, HCR & SUPERCHOKE

17:00 06:00 13.0 DRILL 7.875" HOLE FROM 8981 TO 9275. 294’ @ 22 FPH. WOB 18, ROTARY 51 & MOTOR 67. #1 PUMP ON HOLE

@ 120 SPM, 420 GPM @ 2000 PSI. MUD WT 11.5 & VIS 36

BGG GAS = 4264, CONN GAS = 5046, TRIP GAS =4511 @ 8910, HIGH GAS = 8245 @ 9068
LITHOLOGY: CARB SH =70%, SS =20%, SLTSTN = 10%

SHOWS: ( 8910 — 8982) ( 9048 — 9092) (9172 - 9188)

FORMATION TOPS: KMV PRICE RIVER LOWER @ 9118

MUD LOGGER JOE TISSAW ON LOCATION 15 DAYS

FUEL 6500, USED 1900

CREWS FULL, NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS REPORTED

SAFETY MEETINGS. #1 = TRIPPING, #2 = CLEANING GENERATOR

BOILER RAN 24 HRS
WEATHER + 8 DEGREES
02-13-2008 Reported By PETE COMEAU
DailyCosts: Drilling $34,566 Completion $1,114 Daily Total $35,680
Cum Costs: Drilling $1,194,149 Completion $10,904 Well Total $1,205,053
MD 9,800 TVD 9,800  Progress 525 Days 16 MW 11.7 Visc 36.0
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: CIRCULATE FOR WIPER TRIP
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 15:00 9.0 DRILL 7.875" HOLE FROM 9275 TO 9515. 240’ @ 26 FPH. WOB 18, ROTARY 50 & MOTOR 67. #1 PUMP ON HOLE
@ 120 SPM, 420 GPM @ 2000 PSI. MUD WT 11.6 & VIS 36
15:00 15:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTIONED CROWN O MATIC, PIPE RAMS & KELLY VALVE
15:30 05:00 13.5 DRILL7.875" HOLE FROM 9515 TO 9800 (TD). 285 @ 21 FPH. WOB 18, ROTARY 50 & MOTOR 67. #1 PUMP ON

HOLE @ 120 SPM, 420 GPM @ 2050 PSI. MUD WT 11.6 & VIS 36. REACHED TD AT 05:30 HRS, 2/13/08.

05:00 06:00 1.0 CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN FOR WIPER TRIP.
BGG GAS = 3426, CONN GAS = 6385, HIGH GAS =7122 @ 9380
LITHOLOGY: CARB SH = 70%, SS =20%, SLTSTN = 10%
SHOWS: (9267 — 9315) ( 9336 — 9385) ( 9454 — 9481) ( 9637 — 9652) ( 9756 — 9766)
FORMATION TOPS: SEGO @ 9638
MUD LOGGER JOE TISSAW ON LOCATION 16 DAYS
FUEL 4700, USED 1800
CREWS FULL, NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS REPORTED
SAFETY MEETINGS; #1 = SLIPPERY CONDITIONS, #2 = ROTARY TABLE

BOILER RAN 24 HRS

WEATHER + 10 DEGREES
02-14-2008 Reported By PETE COMEAU
DailyCeosts: Drilling $42,310 Completion $13,121 Daily Total $55.431
Cum Costs: Drilling $1,236,459 Completion $24,025 Well Total $1,260,484
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Well Name: CWU 1183-10

MD 9,800 TVD 9,800
Formation : PBTD: 0.0
Activity at Report Time: RD CEMENT EQUIP

Progress 0

Field: CHAPITA DEEP

Property: 058349

Days 17 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Start End Hrs  Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 CIRCULATE FOR WIPER TRIP

07:00 09:00 2.0 WIPER TRIP 20 STANDS, FLOW CHECK. HOLE IN GOOD CONDITION

09:00 10:30 1.5 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP, 15’ FLARE. RIG UP CALIBER CASING LAY DOWN MACHINE. SAFETY MEETING,

10:30 11:00 0.5 PUMP SLUG, SURVEY

11:00 18:00 7.0 LAY DOWN DRILL STRING. PULL WEAR BUSHING

18:00 19:00 1.0 RIG UP CALIBER CASING SERVICE, SAFETY MEETING.

19:00 23:30 4.5 RUN 4 1/2" PRODUCTION CASING AS FOLLOWS: RUN 231 JOINTS 4 1/2" 11.6#, LT&C, N~80 CASING WITH 2
MARKER JOINTS AS PER TALLY. LAND FLOAT SHOE @ 9795.39, FLOAT COLLAR @ 9751.84°, MJS AT 7035" &
4571°. PICK UP JOINT # 232, TAG BOTTOM & LAY BACK DOWN. PICK UP & LAND DTO HANGER.

23:30 00:30 1.0 RIG DOWN CASERS. BREAK CIRCULATION

00:30 02:30 2.0 CIRCULATE OUT GAS, 30’ FLARE, RIG UP SCHLUMBERGER, SAFETY MEETING.

02:30 05:30 3.0 CEMENT CASING AS FOLLOWS: TEST LINES TO 5000 PSI. PUMP 20 BBLS CHEM WASH FOLLOWED BY 20
BBLS WATER, FOLLOWED BY 1170 SKS ( 364 BBLS) 35/65 POZ LEAD SLURRY MIXED @ 13.0 PPG, YEALD 1.75
FT/3/SK PLUS ADDITIVES FOLLOWED BY 2025 SKS ( 465 BBLS) 50/50 POZ TAIL SLURRY, YEALD 1.29 FT 3 /SK
PLUS ADDITIVES, DISPLACED WITH 151 BBLS FRESH WATER. BUMPED PLUG WITH 1000 PSI OVER FINAL
CIRCULATING PRESSURE., PLUG HELD. LOST RETURNS 435 BBLS INTO TAIL SLURRY.

05:30 06:00 0.5 CEMENTING, RIG DOWN SCHLUMBERGER.

FUEL 3200, USED 1500

CREWS FULL, NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS REPORTED

SAFETY MEETINGS: #1 LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE. #2 CEMENTING

BOILER RAN 24 HRS

WEATHER: HEAVY SNOW, POOR VISIBILITY

MUD LOGGER JOE TISSAW ON LOCATION 16 DAYS
02-15-2008 Reported By PETE COMEAU
DailyCosts: Drilling $8,096 Completion $172,111 Daily Total $180,207
Cum Costs: Drilling $1,244,555 Completion $196,136 Well Total $1,440,691
MD 9,800 TVD 9,800  Progress 0 Days 18 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: RDRT/WO COMPLETION
Start End Hrs  Activity Description

06:00 09:00 3.0 SET & TEST DTO SEALS TO 5000 PSI., NIPPLE DOWN BOP & CLEAN MUD TANKS.

09:00 18:00 9.0 RDMO @ LOCATION 1183~10. MOVE MINI CAMP COMPLETE.

18:00 06:00 12.0 WAIT ON DAYLIGHT

2 CREWS WORKED 12 HRS EACH

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS REPORTED

SAFETY MEETING, WORKING IN SLIPPERY CONDITIONS

TRANSFERED 4 JOINTS CASING & 2 MARKER JOINTS TO CWU 989-15 ON FR 0716
TRANSFERED 3200 GALLONS FUEL TO CWU 989-15 ON FR 0716
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Well Name: CWU 1183-10 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 058349

RIG MOVE 5 MILES 1 WAY
TRUCKS ORDERED @ 07:00 FOR RIG MOVE.

06:00 18.0 RIG RELEASED @ 09:00 HRS, 2/14/08.
CASING POINT COST $1,244,555
02-18-2008 Reported By SEARLE v
DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $44,669 Daily Total $44,669
Cum Costs: Drilling $1,244,555 Completion $240,805 Well Total $1,485,360
MD 9,800 TVD 9,800  Progress 0 Days 19 MW 00  Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTD : 97510 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: PREP TO FRAC
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 18.0 MIRU SCHLUMBEGER. LOG WITH RST/CBL/CCL/VDL/GR FROM PBTD TO 300’. EST CEMENT TOP @ 680°. RD
SCHLUMBERGER.
02-23-2008 Reported By MCCURDY
DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $1,653 Daily Total $1,653
Cum Costs: Drilling $1,244,555 Completion $242,458 Well Total $1,487,013
MD 9800 TVD 9,800  Progress 0 Days 18 MW 0.0 Vise 0.0
Formation : PBTD: 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: WO COMPLETION
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
14:00 15:00 1.0 NU 10M FRAC TREE. PRESSURE TESTED FRAC TREE & CASING TO 6500 PSIG. WO COMPLETION.
JRS
02-26-2008 Reported By HISLOP
DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $1,540 Daily Total $1,540
Cum Costs: Drilling $1,244,555 Completion $243,998 Well Total $1,488,553
MD 9,800 TVD 9,800  Progress 0 Days 18 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 97520 Perf : 9432’ - 9600° PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FRAC
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RU CUTTERS WL. PERFORATED LPR FROM 9432°-34’, 9448’49, 9471°-72°, 9479’-80’, 9500’-01", 9510’-11’,

9539’—40’, 9564’-65°, 9577°-78’, 9591’-92’ & 9599’-9600’ @ 3 SPF & 120° PHASING. RDWL. RU
SCHLUMBERGER. SD FOR PCM REPAIR. SDFN.

02-27-2008 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $26,021 Daily Total $26,021

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,244,555 Completion $270,019 Well Total $1,514,574

MD 9,800 TVD 9.800  Progress 0 Days 19 MW 0.0  Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9752.0 Perf : 8724’ - 9600’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
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Well Name: CWU 1183-10 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 058349

06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 1934 PSIG. RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106, 4149 GAL
WF120 LINEAR PAD, 12736 GAL WF120 LINEAR W/1# & 1.5# 20/40 SAND, 51387 GAL YF116ST+ W/158900#
20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 6105 PSIG. MTR 50.9 BPM. ATP 5017 PSIG. ATR 45.9 BPM. ISIP 3000 PSIG. RD
SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 6K CFP @ 9400’. PERFORATED LPR FROM 9189°—91°, 9217°~18’, 9226’-27", 9254’55, 9258°-59’,
9297°-98’, 9302°-03’, 9312°-13’, 9319°-20’, 9329’30’ & 9384’-85" @ 3 SPF & 120° PHASING. RDWL. RU
SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106, 5650 GAL WF120 LINEAR PAD, 7364
GAL WF120 LINEAR W/1# & 1.5# 20/40 SAND, 43306 GAL YF116ST+ W/130200# 20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP
6319 PSIG. MTR 51.3 BPM. ATP 5093 PSIG. ATR 43.7 BPM. ISIP 3020 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 6K CFP @ 9150’. PERFORATED MPR FROM 8918°-19’, 8958°-59’, 8962°-63’, 9010°-11", 9032°-33",
9035’-36’, 9055’56, 9062’~64’, 9070°-71’, 9123’24’ & 9135’-36" @ 3 SPF & 120° PHASING. RDWL. RU
SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106, 4162 GAL WF120 LINEAR PAD, 6317
GAL WF120 LINEAR W/1# & 1.5# 20/40 SAND, 29360 GAL YF116ST+ W/100000# 20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP
6387 PSIG. MTR 49.9 BPM. ATP 5406 PSIG. ATR 43.4 BPM. ISIP 3525 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 6K CFP @ 8895’. PERFORATED MPR FROM 8724°-25’, 8730°-31", 8740'—41°, 8759°-60’, 8769’-70’,
8797°-98’, 8804'-05°, 8809°'-10’, 8844°—45’, 8849°—50", 8868'—69” & 8876’77’ @ 3 SPF & 120° PHASING. RDWL.
RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106, 5837 GAL WF120 LINEAR PAD,
6324 GAL WF120 LINEAR W/1# & 1.5#, 29511 GAL YF116ST+ W/123239%# 20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 5631 PSIG.
MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 4813 PSIG. ATR 43.8 BPM. ISIP 2930 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER. SDFN.

02-28-2008 Reported By HISLOP
DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $22,445 Daily Total $22,445
Cum Costs: Drilling $1,244,555 Completion $292,464 Well Total $1,537,019
MD 9,800 TVD 9,800  Progress 0 Days 20 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MEASEVERDE PBTD : 9752.0 Perf : 7485’ — 9600 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FRAC
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 2275 PSIG. RUWL. SET 6K CFP @ 8698’. PERFORATED MPR FROM 8574°-75’, 8583’85, 8590°-91°,

8621°-22°, 8626’-27’, 8635’ 36", 8641°-42’, 8664’65, 8672’74’ & 8682’83’ @ 3 SPF & 120° PHASING. RDWL.
RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106, 4140 GAL WF120 LINEAR PAD,
6327 GAL WF120 LINEAR W/1# & 1.5% 20/40 SAND, 31591 GAL YF116ST+ W/108566# 20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG.
MTP 6127 PSIG. MTR 51.4 BPM. ATP 5103 PSIG. ATR 47.1 BPM. ISIP 3350 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 6K CFP @ 8515’. PERFORATED MPR FROM 8342’ —43’, 8361°—62’, 8373’-74’, 8381’-82’, 8388’89,
8425’26, 8432’33, 8439°—4(’, 8456’-57’, 8465’66, 8473’74’ & 8494°-95’ @ 3 SPF & 120° PHASING. RDWL.
RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106, 4173 GAL WF120 LINEAR PAD,
6391 GAL WF120 LINEAR W/1# & 1.5# 20/40 SAND, 50700 GAL YF116ST+ W/174814# 20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG.
MTP 6433 PSIG. MTR 50.4 BPM. ATP 5058 PSIG. ATR 45.7 BPM. ISIP 2950 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 6K CFP @ 8260’. PERFORATED UPR FROM 8051'-52’, 8087°-88’, 8108’09, 8113°-14", 8140’41,
8178’79, 8182°-83’, 8188°-89’, 8227°-28’, 8234’36’ & 8244’45’ @ 3 SPF & 120° PHASING. RDWL. RU
SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106, 4137 GAL WF120 LINEAR PAD, 6323
GAL WF120 LINEAR W/1# & 1.5# 20/40 SAND, 29299 GAL YF116ST+ W/99800# 20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP
6404 PSIG. MTR 50.4 BPM. ATP 5410 PSIG. ATR 45.0 BPM. ISIP 2950 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 6K CFP @ 8000’. PERFORATED UPR FROM 7819’-2(’, 7823’24’ (MISFIRE), 7836°-37’, 7864’65,
7901°-02’, 7908'~09’, 7916’ ~17" (MISFIRE), 7938’39, 7943°—-44’, 7949’-50", 7979’-80’ & 7983’-84" @ 3 SPF & 120°
PHASING. RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106, 3108 GAL
WF120 LINEAR PAD, 6329 GAL WF120 LINEAR W/1# & 1.5# 20/40 SAND, 34277 GAL YF116ST+ W/115300# 20/40
SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 6132 PSIG. MTR 50.4 BPM. ATP 4500 PSIG. ATR 45.3 BPM. ISIP 2500 PSIG. RD
SCHIL.UMBERGER.
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Well Name: CWU 1183-10 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 058349

RUWL. SET 6K CFP @ 7720’. PERFORATED UPR FROM 7485°-86’, 7496’-97°, 7504’05’ 7548’-49’, 7555'-56’,
7562°-63°, 7613'-14’, 7617’ -18’, 7626’-27", 7684’-85’, 7689°-90’ & 7702’~03’ @ 3 SPF & 120° PHASING. RDWL.
RU SCHLUMBERGER. START FRAC. LOST X-LINKER ON 2# STAGE. OVER FLUSHED. RESTARTED FRAC
AFTER REPAIRS & HAD PCM PROBLEM. OVER FLUSHED. SDFN.

02--29-2008 Reported By HISLOP
DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $806 Daily Total $806
Cum Costs: Drilling $1,244,555 Completion $293,270 Well Total $1,537.825
MD 9,800 TVD 9,800  Progress 0 Days 21 MW 00  Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9752.0 Pexf : 7485" — 9600’ PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: PREP TO MIRUSU
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 1700 PSIG. RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106, 4170 GAL

WF120 LINEAR PAD, 6319 GAL WF120 LINEAR W/1# & 1.5# 20/40 SAND, 50819 GAL YF116ST+ W/176300# 20/40
SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 5486 PSIG. MTR 51.3 BPM. ATP 4026 PSIG. ATR 41.4 BPM. ISIP 2390 PSIG. RD
SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10K CBP AT 5703’. BLED OFF PRESSURE. RDWL. SDFN.

03--01-2008 Reported By BAUSCH

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $22,532 Daily Total $22,532

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,244,555 Completion $315,802 Well Total $1,560,357

MD 9,800 TVD 9,800  Progress 0 Days 22 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MEASEVERDE PBTD : 97520 Perf : 7485" — 9600’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MIRUSU. C/O AFTER FRAC.

Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 17:30 11.5 MIRUSU. HOLD SAFETY MTG. ND FRAC TREE. NU BOPE. MU 3 7/8” MILL, POBS, 1 JT 2 3/8” N-80 TBG, XN
NIPPLE. TALLY AND PU 225 JTS. TAGGED PLUG @ 7366. SIFN.
03-04-2008 Reported By BAUSCH
DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $10,993 Daily Total $10,993
Cum Costs: Drilling $1,244,555 Completion $326,795 Well Total $1,571,350
MD 9,800 TVD 9,800  Progress 0 Days 23 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MEASEVERDE PBTD : 9670.0 Perf : 7485" - 9600’ PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
07:00 06:00 23.0 SICP 0 PSIG. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT PLUGS @ 7336’, 7720°, 8000°, 8260°, 8515, 8698, 8895, 9150’ &

9400’. RIH. CLEANED OUT TO PBTD @ 9670°. LANDED TBG AT 8307’ KB. ND BOPE. NU TREE. PUMPED OFF
BIT & SUB. RDMOSU.

FLOWED 13 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FTP 1900 PSIG. CP 2300 PSIG. 85 BFPH. RECOVERED 1015 BLW. 11399
BLWTR.

TUBING DETAIL: LENGTH:

PUMP OFF SUB  1.00°

1JT 2-3/8" 47# N-80 TBG 32.26’
XNNIPPLE 1.30°
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Well Name: CWU 118310 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 058349

253 JTS 2-3/8" 4.7# N-80 TBG  8255.14°
2-3/8" N-80 NIPPLE & COUPLING .60’
BELOWKB 17.00°

LANDED @ 8307.30’KB

03-05-2008 Reported By BAUSCH
DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $2,415 Daily Total $2,415
Cum Costs: Drilling $1,244,555 Completion $329,210 Well Total $1,573,765
MD 9,800 TVD 9,800  Progress 0 Days 24 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MEASEVERDE PBTD : 9670.0 Perf : 7485 - 9600’ PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FTP 1900 PSIG. CP 2400 PSIG. 68 BFPH. RECOVERED1652 BLW. 747 BLWTR.
03-06-2008 Reported By BAUSCH
DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $8,632 Daily Total $8,632
Cum Costs: Drilling $1,244,555 Completion $337,842 Well Total $1,582,397
MD 9,800 TVD 9,800  Progress 0 Days 25 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MEASEVERDE PBTD : 9670.0 Perf : 7485° — 9600° PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 16/64 CHOKE. FTP- 1700 PSIG, CP- 2500 PSIG. 57 BFPH. RECOVERED 1366 BBLS, 8381
BLWTR.
03-07-2008 Reported By BAUSCH
DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $2,415 Daily Total $2,415
Cum Costs: Drilling $1,244,555 Completion $340,257 Well Total $1,584,812
MD 9,800 TVD 9,800  Progress 0 Days 26 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MEASEVERDE PBTD : 9670.0 Perf : 7485 — 9600’ PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 22 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FTP 1950 PSIG. CP 2950 PSIG. 46 BFPH. RECOVERED 1020 BLW. 7361 BLWTR.
03-08-2008 Reported By BAUSCH
DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $2,415 Daily Total $2,415
Cum Costs: Drilling $1,244,555 Completion $342,672 Well Total $1,587,227
MD 9,800 TVD 9,800  Progress 0 Days 27 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MEASEVERDE PBTD : 9670.0 Perf : 7485 — 9600’ PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 19 HRS. 16/64 CHOKE. FTP- 1900 PSIG, CP- 2900 PSIG. 35 BFPH. RECOVERED 676 BBLS, 6685
BLWTR.
03-09-2008 Reported By BAUSCH
DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $2,415 Daily Total $2,415
Cum Costs: Drilling $1,244,555 Completion $345,087 Well Total $1,589,642
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Well Name: CWU 1183-10 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 058349

MD 9,800 TVD 9,800  Progress 0 Days 28 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MEASEVERDE PBTD : 9670.0 Perf : 7485° — 9600° PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST
Start End Hrs  Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 24 HRS. 16/64 CHOKE. FTP- 1800 PSIG, CP-2500 PSIG. 24 BFPH. RECOVFLOERED 590 BBLS, 6095 BLWTR.

DRAIN FLOW LINES. SHUT WELL IN.
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STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

FORM 9

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to 7. UNIT or GA AGREEMENT NAME.
drill horizontal laterals. ljse APPLICXTIOIEI FOR PEIngT TO DRILL form for such proposgls’. pluos ' WONSITS VALLEY UNIT
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
oLwell [1  cAsweLL OTHER WV 3W-12-8-21
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. 4304734267
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
11002 E. 17500 S. ., VERNAL srare UT 84078 (435) 781-4301 WONSITS VALLEY
4. LOCATION OF WELL
Footaces AT sURFACE: 788' FNL 1941' FWL county: UINTAH
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 12 8S 21E STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[] NOTICE OF INTENT ] Acioize [] oeeren [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit in Duplicate) [] ALterRcasiNG [] FracTURE TREAT [ ] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [] casinG RePAR [[] NewconsTRucCTION [T] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
] CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [] OPERATOR CHANGE [] 7usinerePaR
|:| CHANGE TUBING [[] PLuG AND ABANDON [] venTORFLARE
[/l sussEQUENT REPORT [] cHaNGE WELL NAME [ pueceack [] warer DisPoSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[7] chanGE WeLL STATUS [] PropuCTION (START/RESUME) ] waTeR sHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:
|:] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE otHer: MONTHLY
[] converTweLL TYPE [C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION STATUS REPORT

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Exploration & Production Company submits this sundry to report there has been no activity on the above captioned

well since the date of the DSI Status Extension. (October 2007)

NAME (PLEASE PrINT)_-@ura Bills TITLE

Associate Regulatory Affairs Analyst

L By &/

4/8/2008

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

RECEWED (CONFIDENTIAL

APR 10 2008

(5/2000)

(See Instructions on Reverse Side) Div OF O“., CAS & M“‘\”NG



s PRI gAY
STATE OF UTAH : > ij : q i i FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES Lid i I W e 35
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING ” 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A

D t this f i Is to drill |l fi ly di lis bel t bottom-hole depth, ter pl d well 7. T or O AOREEMENT NAME.
0 not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

1. TYPE OF WELL
oLweLL [  GAsweLL OTHER WV 3W-12-8-21
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. AP| NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. 4304734267
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
11002 E. 17500 S. oary VERNAL stare UT ;84078 (435) 781-4301 WONSITS VALLEY
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 788' FNL. 1941' FWL county: UINTAH
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 12  8S 21E STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[ NOTICE OF INTENT [] Acioize ] oeePen [] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit in Duplicate) [] AuTERcasiNG [] FRACTURE TREAT [] siDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: |:| CASING REPAIR D NEW CONSTRUCTION |:| TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[[] crancE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [[] orerATOR cHANGE [] TusiNG REPAR
[] cHanGE TUBING [7] PLUG AND ABANDON [[] ventorrLARE
[Vl SuBSEQUENT REPORT [[] cHANGE WELL NAME (] puseack ] warter DisposaL
{Submit Original Form Only)
[[] cHanGe weLL sTATUS [[] PRODUGTION (START/RESUME) [[] waTeR sHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:
[[] cOMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE otHErR: MONTHLY
] CONVERT WELL TYPE [] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION STATUS REPORT

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Exploration & Production Company submits this sundry to report there has been no activity on the above captioned
well since the date of the DSI Status Extension. (October 2007)

NAME (PLEASE priN)_-@ura Bills mme Associate Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE __{ / M ﬁ/ / % oate  2/5/2008

(This space for State use only) RECE‘VED -
way 06 2xaCONFIDENTIAL

{5/2000}) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) D‘V- OF O“_’ GAS & M‘N‘NG



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

A B

L:u.w‘ ;J’unin»',
FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

N/A
b " X I aril . . I denth  well 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
oo e s el G i Y, ST o gl S e ol sty ootk 0| WONSITS VALLEY UNIT
1. TYPE OF WELL OIL WELL I:I GAS WELL OTHER 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WV 3W-12-8-21
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. 4304734267
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
11002 E. 17500 S. ary VERNAL state YT 584078 (435) 781-4301 WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 788' FNL 1941' FWL

21E

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW © 12 8S

county: UINTAH

STATE:
UTAH

1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

] acoize

ALTER CASING

[] oeeren

[l NoTice oF INTENT
[[] FracTURE TREAT

(Submit in Duplicate}
Approximate date work wili start:

CASING REPAIR [[] ~ewconsTRuCTION

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D OPERATOR CHANGE
CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON
V] SUBSEQUENT REPORT PLUG BACK

(Submit Original Form Only)
CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME)
Date of work completion:

L]
CHANGE WELL NAME O
L]
[l

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE

OoOoooooono

O

CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

[[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
[[] sIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

[[] TeEmMPORARILY ABANDON

[J tuencrepaR

[J venToORFLARE

[] waTeR DIsPosAL

[[] waATER SHUT-OFF

otHer: MONTHLY
STATUS REPORT

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Exploration & Production Company submits this sundry to report there has been no activity on the above captioned

well since the date of the DSI Status Extension. (October 2007)

RECEIVED

JUN 09 2088
DIV, OF OIL, GAS &MINING

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Laura Bills TITLE

Associate Regulatory Affairs Analyst

6/3/2008

V=7 /7))

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

CONFIDENTIAL

T



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

N/A
) ] o » 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
O s o et b el s xS St ko, e st | 'WONSITS VALLEY UNIT
1. TYPE OF WELL D GAS WELL OTHER 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
OlL WELL WV 3W-12-8-21
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APl NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. 4304734267
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
11002 E. 17500 S. .y VERNAL erare UT 084078 (435) 781-4301 WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 788" FNL 1941' FWL

county: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 12 885 21E STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
] acibize [C] oeePen [] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
[l NoTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) [] ALTERCASING [] FrRACTURE TREAT [[] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: |:| CASING REPAIR |:] NEW CONSTRUCTION D TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[[] cHance TO PREVIOUS PLANS [J operator cHance [} tueiNG REPAR
[] cHanGeTUBING [[] PLuc AND ABANDON [] VENTORFLARE
(/] SUBSEQUENT REPORT ] CHANGE WELL NAME [J pLuesack [[] WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[] cHaNGE weLL sTATUS [J ProDUCTION (START/RESUME) [] WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:
|:] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE oTHER: MONTHLY
[ converT weLL TYPE [C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION STATUS REPORT

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Exploration & Production Company submits this sundry to report there has been no activity on the above captioned

well since the date of the DSI Status Extension. (October 2007)

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)

Laura Bills mme Associate Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE m M e 81212008

{This space for State use only)

RECEIVED. 0ONFIDENTIAT
AUG

14 2008

DiV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

(5/2000) {See Instructions on Reverse Side)



PRESSTIC s N LN R SR

STATE OF UTAH i FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES vt kR BT

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS A OTIER TR RS

Do not this form f Is to drill lls, significantly d 4 lIs bel t bottom-hole depth, ter pl d well t 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
o not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

olLWELL [] GAS WELL OTHER

WV 3wW-12-8-21
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. 4304734267
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
11002 E. 17500 S. oary VERNAL srate YT 784078 (435) 781-4301 WONSITS VALLEY
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 788" FNL 1941' FWL county: UINTAH
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 12 8S 21E STATE:
UTAH
11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[ NOTICE OF INTENT [] acibize [] oeeren [] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit in Duplicate) [] ALTERcAsING [] FracTURE TREAT [[] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start [] casiNG REPAR [] NewconsTRUCTION [] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[] cHancE To PREVIOUS PLANS [] operaTOR cHANGE [] tuencrepair
] cHanGe TuBING [] Pruc AND ABANDON [] VENTORFLARE
(/] susseQuUENT REPORT [] cHaNGE WELL NAME [] pruceack [] waTER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[[] CHANGE WELL STATUS [[] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [] WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:
[[] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE other: MONTHLY
] converT weLL TYPE [C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION STATUS REPORT

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Exploration & Production Company submits this sundry to report there has been no activity on the above captioned
well since the date of the DSI Status Extension. (October 2007)

NAME (PLeASE PrinT)_L@Ura Bills mme Associate Regulatory Affairs Analyst

9/2/2008

SIGNATURE ~ DATE

(This space for State use only) R EC E ' VE D ‘ ‘ N
sos i CONFIDENTIA

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse SEH)/. OF 0”_, GAS & M'NING



STATE OF UTAH T FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES L i
DIVISION OF O“_, GAS AND MININ@O N Fl n r:kITlAL 5. LEASE DE@GNATlON AND SERlAL NUMBER:

v UTU-0806"+: , |
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6N|;AN o

Do not use this form f Is to drill il ficantly d 1 lis bell t bottom-hole depth, ter pl d well T, UNIT of GA AOREEMENT NAME:
0 not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

oLweLL []  GASWELL OTHER WV 3W-12-8-21
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. AP NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. 4304734267
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10, FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
11002 E. 17500 S. oary VERNAL stare UT ;84078 (435) 781-4301 WONSITS VALLEY
4, LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 788' FNL 1941' FWL county: UINTAH
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 12 8S 21E STATE:
UTAH
11, CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[] NOTICE OF INTENT [] acioize [] oeePen [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit in Duplicate) ] ALTERcAsING [] FracTure TREAT [] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: |:| CASING REPAIR |___] NEW CONSTRUCTION |:| TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[] cHanGE To PREVIOUS PLANS [] oPeraTOR cHANGE [] TuBING REPAIR
[ cHanGETUBING [] PLuG AND ABANDON [] ventorFLARE
[/] SUBSEQUENT REPORT ] CHANGE WELL NAME [J Pwesack [] waTer DisPosaL
{Submit Original Form Only)
[C] CHANGE WELL STATUS [[] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [] WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:
|:] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE otier: MONTHLY
(] converT weLL TYPE [] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION STATUS REPORT

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Exploration & Production Company submits this sundry to report there has been no activity on the above captioned
well since the date of the DSI Status Extension. (October 2007)

nawE (PLEAsE prINT)_LaUra Bills mme Associate Regulatory Affairs Analyst

, . 1 £
SIGNATURE ﬁ% ’ﬁ%/ﬂ oare  10/8/2008

RECEIVED CONFIDENTIAL

OCT 1% 7008
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING

{5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS A HAOTEE TR

Do not th P Is to drill I Foantly d tom-hole denth tor bl J 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
o not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drilt horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

OLWELL [[]  GASWELL OTHER WV 3W-12-8-21
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. AP NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. 4304734267
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT-
11002 E. 17500 S. oy VERNAL state YT 584078 (435) 781-4301 WONSITS VALLEY
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT sURFACE: 788" FNL 1941' FWL county: UINTAH
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 12 8S 21E STATE:
UTAH
. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[ NOTICE OF INTENT [] Acibize [] osepen [] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit in Duplicate) [[] ALTER CASING [T] eracTURE TREAT [] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start; [[] casiNG REPAIR [[] NEWCONSTRUCTICN [] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[] cHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [] OPERATOR CHANGE [] tuemnGRePAR
[[] cHANGE TUBING [[] PLUG AND ABANDON ] veNTORFLARE
[V] SUBSEQUENT REPORT [[] CHANGE WELL NAME [] rusBack [] water DIsPosSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[[] CHANGEWELL STATUS [[] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [[] waTeR SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:
[ ] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE orier: MONTHLY
[] CONVERT WELL TYPE [ ReCOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION STATUS REPORT

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Exploration & Production Company submits this sundry to report there has been no activity on the above captioned
well since the date of the DSI Status Extension. (October 2007)

RECEIVEU
NOV § & 2008
DIV, OF OiL, GAS & MINING

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)_-@Ura Bills mme Associate Regulatory Affairs Analyst

~ . . 4
SIoNATURE %{%/ M e 11/3/2008

(This space for State use only)

CONFIDENTIAL

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
dril horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
N/A

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

OLWELL []  GASWELL OTHER WV 3W-12-8-21
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. 4304734267
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
11002 E. 17500 S. oy VERNAL stare UT 584078 (435) 781-4301 WONSITS VALLEY
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 788' FNL 1941' FWL county: UINTAH
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 12 8S 21E STATE:
UTAH
1, CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[] NOTICE OF INTENT [ acioize [] oeeren [C] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit in Duplicate) [] ALteErcasiNg [] rracTurE TREAT [C] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start [] casing REPAR [] newconsTRUCTION [C] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[7] cHance To PREVIOUS PLANS [] operaTOR cHANGE [] tueingRePaR
[[] cHANGE TuBING [] Pruc aND ABANDON [] VENTORFLARE
[/] suBSEQUENT REPORT [[] cHANGE weLL NAME [] eLucsack [] wATER DisPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[[] CHANGE WELL STATUS [[] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [[] WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:
[C] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE /] other: MONTHLY
[] CONVERT WELL TYPE [C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION STATUS REPORT

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Exploration & Production Company submits this sundry to report there has been no activity on the above captioned

well since the date of the DSI Status Extension. (October 2007)

Laura Bills

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) TITLE

Associate Regulatory Affairs Analyst

12/2/2008

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
DEC 08 2008
(see nstructions PIREOR O, GAS & MINING

(5/2000)

GONFIDENTIAL



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

8. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

N/A

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Pt e o gl ol ety e g e ot oo sty rrr il 70| WONSITS VALLEY UNIT
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
olLWELL [] - GASWELL i oTHER WV 3W-12-8-21
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. 4304734267
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDGAT:
11002 E. 17500 8. .., VERNAL stare UT 84078 (435) 781-4301 WONSITS VALLEY
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 788" FNL 1941' FWL county: UINTAH
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 12 88 21E STATE:
R UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[ NOTICE OF INTENT [ acioize [] oeepen [] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit in Duplicate) [ Atercasine [C] FrAcTURE TREAT [[] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date workwil strt: ~ |[T]  cASING REPAIR [ wewconstRucTION [] TeMPORARILY ABANDON
[C] cHaneEe To PREVIOUS PLANS [ operator chaneE [] TueiNGRePAIR
[[] cHancE TuBING [] PLueAND ABANDON [] venoRFLARE
[Vl sussequeNT REPORT [] cHanGE wELL NAME [] pesack [] waterDisPosAL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[C] cHANGE WELL STATUS [] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [] waTeR sHuT-OFF
Date of work complation: v
[C] cOMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS || ‘RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE /] orer: MONTHLY.
[C] CONVERTWELL TYPE [C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION STATUS REPORT

12. ‘DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent detalls including dates, depths, volumes, efc.

Questar Exploration & Production Company submits this sundry to report there has been no activity on the above captioned

well since the date of the DSI Status Extension. (October 2007)

mme Associate Regulatory Affairs Analyst

1/5/2009

DATE

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
JAN 08 2009

(612000}

(See Instructions on ReverQWdQF OlL, GAS & MlNING

CONFIDERTIAL



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 6

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator Questar Exploration and Production Co. Operator Account Number: N 5085
Address: 11002 E. 17500 S.
City Vernal
State Ut Zip 84078 Phone Number:  (435) 7814360 \21{2
Wall 1
AP! Number Woell Name QQ Sec |Twp | Rng County
4304734251 WV 16W-15-8-21 SESE | 15 | 080S | 210E UINTAH
Actlon Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effectlve Date
D 14864 17123 11/1/2007
Comments: WMMED L 1/29/2009
Well 2
APl Number Woell Name QQ Sec | Twp | Rng County
4304734265 WV 2W-12-8-21 NWNE | 12 | 080S | 210E UINTAH
Actlon Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date
D 14864 17123 11/1/2007
Comments:
WMMFD - 1/29/2009
Wall 3
API Number Well Name QQ Sec | Twp |Rng County
4304734267 WV 3W-12-8-21 NENW | 12 |080S | 210E UINTAH
Actlon Code Current Entlty New Entlty Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date
D 14864 17123 11/1/2007
Comments:
WMMFD RECEIVED - 1/29/2009
JAN 26 2009

e Cortoa

A TION CODES: PIV. OF OIL, GAS & Mi o (Ploase Print)

A -Establish new entity for new well (single well only
B -Add new well to existing entity (group or unit well)
C -Re-assign well from one existing entity to another exlsting entity

D -Re-assign well from one existing g tity Stanat 2 s
E -Other (Explain in " n:;‘;:.. 14\ L ()-F&oc Acdmin \l 009
AL Title Date

(65/2000)



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

CONFIDENTIAL

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU-0806
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS A AHOTTE CRTEERALE
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to 7V\lngT§rS(:ﬁiX§R€XAENLTE’\I¢ME NIT
drilt horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL D GAS WELL OTHER 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
OIL WELL WV 3W-12-8-21
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APt NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. 4304734267
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
11002 E. 17500 S. oy VERNAL stare UT 584078 (435) 781-4301 WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 788 FNL. 1941' FWL

county: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 12 8S 21E STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
] Acioize [C] oeeren [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
[T] NoOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) [ ALtercasing [0 rracture TREAT [C] sIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [] casingRePaR [C] n~ewconsTRucTION [] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[ cHance To PREVIOUS PLANS [C] operator cHaNGE [J] rusiNG REPAIR
[] cHanGE TuBING [] PLucanp AsanDON [] ventorFLare
[/l suBSEQUENT REPORT [0 cHance weLL name [ euesack [C] watER DIsPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[C] cHance weLL sTATUS [] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [[] WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:
|:] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS EI RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |Z| otHer: MONTHLY
[ convert weLL TvpE [] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION STATUS REPORT

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Exploration & Production Company submits this sundry to report there has been no activity on the above captioned

well since the date of the DSI Status Extension. (October 2007)

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Laura Bills

mme Associate Regulatory Affairs Analyst

2/2/2009

=y 274 M

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED

(56/2000) {See Instructions on Reverse Side)

FEB 0 4 7009

DN.QF oI, GAS & MININR



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS Gi\;j,f""‘"' ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not this form f Is to drill Il lls bel by hole d I d well 7. UNIT or GAAGREEMENT NME:
0 not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

OLWELL []  GASWELL OTHER WV 3W-12-8-21
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. 4304734267
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
11002 E. 17500 S. oy VERNAL stare UT 84078 (435) 781-4301 WONSITS VALLEY
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 788' FNL 1941' FWL county: UINTAH
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 12 8S  21E STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[ NOTICE OF INTENT ] Acibize [] oeepen [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit in Duplicate) [[] Autercasing [C] FracTURE TREAT [[] sipETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: | ["] CASING REPAIR [] newconsTrucTion [C] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[] cHaNeE To PREVIOUS PLANS [C] oreraTor cHancE [C] tusingREPAIR
[] cHance TusiNG [] PLucAND ABANDON [] VENTORFLARE
[/] SUBSEQUENT REPORT [] cHaNGE WELL NAME [] rruesack [] water DisposaL
(Submit Original Form Only)
Dete of work commiet [] cHaneE weLL sTATUS [[] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [] waTER SHUT-OFF
ale of work completion:
° [[] comminGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE otHer: MONTHLY
[] convertweLL TyPe [] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION STATUS REPORT

12. DESCRIBE PROPQOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Exploration & Production Company set conductor on 09/25/2003. This location is on Questar's future drilling schedule.

NAME (PLeAsE priny_L-aUra Bills me Associate Regulatory Affairs Analyst
SIGNATURE oate  3/4/2009
==
{This space for State use only) REG i & 14 ED

MAR 03 2003 GONFIDENTIAL

DIV, OF i, 243 & MINING

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)



STATEOFUTAH o , FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOUREEY |
1 UTU-0806

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MI IN
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS T ALOTIEE OR TRBERAME

gt

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. WONSlTS VALLEY UNIT

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

1. TYPE OF WELL
OILWELL [] GAS WELL OTHER WV 3W-12-8-21
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. 4304734267
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
11002 E. 17500 S. 7, VERNAL soare UT 84078 (435) 781-4301 WONSITS VALLEY
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 788' FNL 1941' FWL county: UINTAH
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 12 88 21E STATE:
UTAH
1, CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[1 NOTICE OF INTENT [ Acioize [[] oeepen [] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit in Duplicate) [] ALTERCASING [] FRACTURE TREAT [C] sipETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [[] casin REPAR [] newconsTRucTION [C] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[[] CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [] operaToR cHANGE [] TuBiNG REPAIR
[:! CHANGE TUBING [[] PLUG AND ABANDON (] venTORFLARE
[Vl suBsEQUENT REPORT [] cHANGE wELL NAME [] pLucBeack [T] waTteR DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)
Date of work i [[] cHANGE WELL STATUS [[] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) |:] WATER SHUT-OFF
ate of work compiletion:
° |:| COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE otHer: MONTHLY
[J converrweLL TYPE [[] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION STATUS REPORT

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Exploration & Production Company set conductor on 09/25/2003. This location is on Questar's future drilling schedule.

NAME (PLEASE pRINT) _L8Ura Bills me Associate Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE m‘ 6/% oare 4212009

(This space for State use only) R EC E 'VE D
APR 07 2009
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) DlV. OF OlLl GAS & MINING



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESO

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU-0806

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS NIA

b h " s to gl " i . s bel b deoth ; el 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
0 not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

OLWELL []  GASWELL OTHER WV 3W-12-8-21
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. 4304734267
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT.
11002 E. 17500 S. oy VERNAL state VT 584078 (435) 781-4301 WONSITS VALLEY
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 788' FNL 1941' FWL county: UINTAH
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 12 8S 21E STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[ NOTICE OF INTENT [ acioize [] oeepen [C] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit in Duplicate) [] Autercasing [T] FRACTURE TREAT [O] sioeTRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [] casinG REPAIR [J ~ewconsTRucTiON [] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[] cHancE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [] orerATOR cHaNGE [] rusinG RePAIR
[] cHance TuBING [J Puc AND ABANDON [[] venTorFLARE
(/] SUBSEQUENT REPORT [ crance weL Nave [] pueeack [} water bispPosaL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[[] cHANGE WELL STATUS [C] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [] waTER sHuT-OFF
Date of work completion:
[[] cOMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE otHeEr: MONTHLY
[ convertweLL TYPE [C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION STATUS REPORT

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Exploration & Production Company set conductor on 09/25/2003. This location is on Questar's future drilling schedule.

NAME (PLEASE priNT)_aura Bills rme Associate Regulatory Affairs Analyst

Z ) 5/4/2009

SIGNATURE ’ A DATE

(This space for State use only) R EC E IVE D
MAY 07 2009

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) DW OF OH‘! GAS & M”‘-”NG



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

I FORM 9

RRLON AND SERIAL NUMBER:

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A

Do not his form f Is to drill I ficantly d Iis bel t bottom-hole depth, ter p! d well T O oA FOREEMENT N
o not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

1. TYPE OF WELL
oiLweLL []  GASWELL OTHER WV 3W-12-8-21
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 5. APl NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. 4304734267
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
11002 E. 17500 S. oy VERNAL stare YT 84078 (435) 781-4301 WONSITS VALLEY
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FoOTAGES AT sURFACE: 788' FNL. 1941' FWL county: UINTAH
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 12 8S  21E STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[] NOTICE OF INTENT [ acibize [ oeepen [] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit in Duplicate) [] AuTER CASING [J rrACTURE TREAT [] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: |:| CASING REPAIR |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION |:| TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[C] chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS [] oreraTOR CHANGE [ rusinG RePAR
[ cHance TUBING [[] PLuG AND ABANDON [] venTorFuare
[/] suesequENT REPORT [] cHANGE WELL NAME ] Puesack ] WATER DISPOSAL
{Submit Original Form Only}
[[] CHANGE WELL STATUS [] PRODUCTION (STARTRESUME) [[] WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:
[:] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |____| RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |Z] otHer: MONTHLY
[ converTweLL TYPE [C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION STATUS REPORT

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Exploration & Production Company set conductor on 09/25/2003. This location is on Questar's future drilling schedule.

NAME (PLEASE prin)_-a@uUra Bills me Associate Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE m %f/% oare _06/4/2009

=

RECEIVED——
JUN 08 2009
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)



STATE OF UTAH R i ! = ¥ H FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURKCE
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINI E . L_?/SE(I)D;E%NATION AND SERIALNUMBER:

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS WA

D t this f fi Is to drill 1l ficantly di t lls bels t bottom-hale depth, ter pl d well ht 7. UNIT or GA AGREEMENT NAME:
0 not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
oLwelL [ GASWELL OTHER WV 3W-12-8-21
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. 4304734267
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
11002 E. 17500 S. oary VERNAL srare UT 584078 (435) 781-4331 WONSITS VALLEY
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 788" FNL 1941' FWL county: UINTAH
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 12 8S  21E STATE:
UTAH
1. . CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[] NOTICE OF INTENT [ Acioize [] oeEPen ] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit in Duplicate) [] ALteErcasiNG [C] FRACTURE TREAT ] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [C] cAsING REPAIR [ newconsTRucTiON [[] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[] CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [C] operaTOR cHANGE [] tusing REPAR
[C] cHancE TusiNG [] PLuG AND ABANDON ] veNnTORFLARE
[/] suBSEQUENT REPORT [] cHANGE WELL NAME ] prueeack [] wartER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[] CHANGE WELL STATUS [[] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [[] warTeR sHuT-oFF
Date of work completion:
[] cOMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE ] orrer: MONTHLY
[C] CONVERT WELL TYPE [] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION STATUS REPORT

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Exploration & Production Company set conductor on 09/25/2003. This location is on Questar's future drilling schedule.

NAME (PLEA .NT) JANNELSON e Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATURE A7) (/i/@,/é A oare 77112009

(This space foy State use only)

RECEIVED
JUL 06 2009
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)



API Well No: 43047342670000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
UTE

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WV 3W-12-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO

9. API NUMBER:
43047342670000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-4362 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
0788 FNL 1941 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 12 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
UINTAH

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING D CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT D NEW CONSTRUCTION
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
/ DRILLING REPORT
. D WATER SHUTOFF D SI TA STATUS EXTENSION D APD EXTENSION
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION !/ OTHER OTHER: Monthly Status Report

Questar Exploration & Production Company set conductor on 09/25/2003.
This location is on Questar's future drilling schedule.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECQRD.QMNLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Jan Nelson 435 781-4331 Permit Agent
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 8/5/2009

RECEIVED_August 05, 2009




API Well No: 43047342670000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
UTE

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WV 3W-12-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO

9. API NUMBER:
43047342670000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, UT, 84078

PHONE NUMBER:
435 781-4362 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
0788 FNL 1941 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 12 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
UINTAH

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON
D D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE
SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE
/ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: [ waTer sHuTOFF L] s1TA STATUS EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER

CASING REPAIR

CHANGE WELL NAME

CONVERT WELL TYPE

NEW CONSTRUCTION

OooOoooao

PLUG BACK
(|

D TEMPORARY ABANDON

RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

D WATER DISPOSAL
D APD EXTENSION

OTHER:

No activity on this well during the month of August, 2009.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECQRR.ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)
Jan Nelson

PHONE NUMBER
435 781-4331

TITLE
Permit Agent

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
9/1/2009

RECEIVED September 01, 2009




API Well No: 43047342670000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
UTE

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WV 3W-12-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO

9. API NUMBER:
43047342670000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, UT, 84078

PHONE NUMBER:
435 781-4362 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
0788 FNL 1941 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 12 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
UINTAH

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON
D D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE
SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE
/ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: [ waTer sHuTOFF L] s1TA STATUS EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER

CASING REPAIR

CHANGE WELL NAME

CONVERT WELL TYPE

NEW CONSTRUCTION

OooOoooao

PLUG BACK

D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D TEMPORARY ABANDON

D WATER DISPOSAL

D APD EXTENSION

OTHER:

No activity on this well for the month of September 2009.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORDP.ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Jan Nelson 435 781-4331 Permit Agent
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 10/8/2009

RECEIVED October 08, 2009




API Well No: 43047342670000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
UTE

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WV 3W-12-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO

9. API NUMBER:
43047342670000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, UT, 84078

PHONE NUMBER:
435 781-4362 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
0788 FNL 1941 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 12 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
UINTAH

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON
D D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE
SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE
/ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: [ waTer sHuTOFF L] s1TA STATUS EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER

CASING REPAIR

CHANGE WELL NAME

CONVERT WELL TYPE

NEW CONSTRUCTION

OooOoooao

PLUG BACK
(|

D TEMPORARY ABANDON

RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

D WATER DISPOSAL
D APD EXTENSION

OTHER:

No activity on this well during the month of October 2009.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR REGQRR. ONJY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)
Jan Nelson

PHONE NUMBER
435 781-4331

TITLE
Permit Agent

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
11/2/2009

RECEIVED November 02, 2009




API Well No: 43047342670000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
UTE

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WV 3W-12-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO

9. API NUMBER:
43047342670000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, UT, 84078

PHONE NUMBER:
435 781-4362 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
0788 FNL 1941 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 12 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
UINTAH

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON
D D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE
SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE
/ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: [ waTer sHuTOFF L] s1TA STATUS EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER

CASING REPAIR

CHANGE WELL NAME

CONVERT WELL TYPE

NEW CONSTRUCTION

OooOoooao

PLUG BACK
(|

D TEMPORARY ABANDON

RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

D WATER DISPOSAL
D APD EXTENSION

OTHER:

No activity on this well during the month of November 2009.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR REGQRD, OMLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)
Jan Nelson

PHONE NUMBER
435 781-4331

TITLE
Permit Agent

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
12/1/2009

RECEIVED December 01, 2009




API Well No: 43047342670000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
UTE

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WV 3W-12-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO

9. API NUMBER:
43047342670000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, UT, 84078

PHONE NUMBER:
435 781-4362 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
0788 FNL 1941 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 12 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
UINTAH

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON
D D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE
SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE
/ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: [ waTer sHuTOFF L] s1TA STATUS EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER

CASING REPAIR

CHANGE WELL NAME

CONVERT WELL TYPE

NEW CONSTRUCTION

OooOoooao

PLUG BACK
(|

D TEMPORARY ABANDON

RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

D WATER DISPOSAL
D APD EXTENSION

OTHER:

No activity on this well during the month of December 2009.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECOQRDP.,OMLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)
Jan Nelson

PHONE NUMBER
435 781-4331

TITLE
Permit Agent

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
1/4/2010

RECEIVED_ January 04, 2010




API Well No: 43047342670000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
UTE

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WV 3W-12-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO

9. API NUMBER:
43047342670000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, UT, 84078

PHONE NUMBER:
435 781-4362 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
0788 FNL 1941 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 12 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
UINTAH

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON
D D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE
SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE
/ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: [ waTer sHuTOFF L] s1TA STATUS EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER

CASING REPAIR

CHANGE WELL NAME

CONVERT WELL TYPE

NEW CONSTRUCTION

OooOoooao

PLUG BACK

D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D TEMPORARY ABANDON

D WATER DISPOSAL

D APD EXTENSION

OTHER:

No activity on this well during the month of January 2010.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECOQRD ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER

TITLE

Jan Nelson 435 781-4331 Permit Agent
SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 2/1/2010




API Well No: 43047342670000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
UTE

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WV 3W-12-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO

9. API NUMBER:
43047342670000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, UT, 84078

PHONE NUMBER:
435 781-4362 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
0788 FNL 1941 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 12 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
UINTAH

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON
D D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE
SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE
/ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: [ waTer sHuTOFF L] s1TA STATUS EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER

CASING REPAIR

CHANGE WELL NAME

CONVERT WELL TYPE

NEW CONSTRUCTION

OooOoooao

PLUG BACK
(|

D TEMPORARY ABANDON

RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

D WATER DISPOSAL
D APD EXTENSION

OTHER:

No activity on this well during the month of March 2010.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORP ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)
Jan Nelson

PHONE NUMBER
435 781-4331

TITLE
Permit Agent

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
4/5/2010

RECEIVED April 05, 2010




API Well No: 43047342670000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
UTE

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WV 3W-12-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO

9. API NUMBER:
43047342670000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, UT, 84078

PHONE NUMBER:
435 781-4362 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
0788 FNL 1941 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 12 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
UINTAH

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON
D D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE
SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE
/ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: [ waTer sHuTOFF L] s1TA STATUS EXTENSION
4/30/2010
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER

CASING REPAIR

CHANGE WELL NAME

CONVERT WELL TYPE

NEW CONSTRUCTION

OooOoooao

PLUG BACK

D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D TEMPORARY ABANDON

D WATER DISPOSAL

D APD EXTENSION

OTHER:

No activit on this well during the month of April 2010.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR REGORD,QNLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Jan Nelson 435 781-4331 Permit Agent
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 5/6/2010

RECEIVED May 06, 2010




API Well No: 43047342670000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
UTE

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WV 3W-12-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO

9. API NUMBER:
43047342670000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, UT, 84078

PHONE NUMBER:
303 308-3068 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
0788 FNL 1941 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 12 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
UINTAH

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON
D D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE
SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE
/ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: [ waTer sHuTOFF L] s1TA STATUS EXTENSION
5/31/2010
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER

CASING REPAIR

CHANGE WELL NAME

CONVERT WELL TYPE

NEW CONSTRUCTION

OooOoooao

PLUG BACK
(|

D TEMPORARY ABANDON

RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

D WATER DISPOSAL
D APD EXTENSION

OTHER:

No activity on this well during the month of May 2010.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECQRD,QNLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)
Jan Nelson

PHONE NUMBER
435 781-4331

TITLE
Permit Agent

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
6/2/2010

RECEIVED June(2, 2010




Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET  (for state use only)
Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/14/2010
FROM: (0Old Operator): TO: (New Operator):
N5085-Questar Exploration and Production Company N3700-QEP Energy Company
1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265
Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048 Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048
CA No. Unit: WONSITS VALLEY
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG|API NO ENTITY |LEASE TYPE|WELL [WELL
NO TYPE STATUS
SEE ATTACHED ;

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

Enter date after each listed item is completed

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/28/2010
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/28/2010
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commeree, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/24/2010
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143
Sa. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Requested
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c¢. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 8/16/2010 BIA not yet

7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 8/16/2010
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 6/29/2010

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/30/2010
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/30/2010
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965010693
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965010695

3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS:

QEP Enerav (Wansits Vallaw) FORM & vie N22AMA4N



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER.
See attached
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS e e O S O TRIBE NAME

See attached

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to S ee atta ch d
drill horizonta! laterais. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. €

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
oL WeLL [] GASWELL [ ] OTHER See attached

1 TYPE OF WELL

2 NAME OF OPERATOR: ) - 9. APl NUMBER:
Questar Exploration and Production Company /V I, 0 b1 5 Attached
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR; PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1050 17th Street, Suite 500,  Denver arsze ©0 . 80265 (303) 672-6900 See attached
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:  See attached county:. Attached
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE. MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH
1 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT [ L] 0
{Submit in Duplicate) [] ALtercasinG [] FrACTURE TREAT [C] sioeTrack 70 REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [T] casingrerar [[] ~ewconsTRuCTION [ TemPoraRILY ABANDON
6/14/2010 [] crance To PREVIOUS PLANS [] operator crance [] TuencrepPar
[] cHance rusinG [[] PLucanD asanpon [T] venTORFLARE
[] SUBSEQUENT REPORT [[] crance weLL name [ Pesack ] water DiseosaL
{Submit Original Form Only)
[[] crance wew sTatus [C] ProbucTION (STARTRESUME) [[] water sHuT-oFF
Date of work completion;
[T] commngLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS {1 RecLamation oF weLL siTE otHer: Operator Name
[] convert wew Type [[] RecOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Change

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective June 14, 2010 Questar Exploration and Production Company changed its name to QEP Energy Company. This name
change involves only an internal corporate name change and no third party change of operator is involved. The same
employees will continue to be responsible for operations of the properties described on the attached list. All operations will
continue to be covered by bond numbers: ,

Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLM Reference No. ESB000024) /\J '-3 7M

Utah State Bond Number: 965663633 - ; ] ;

Fee Land Bond Number: 96500363-3-) 9("5@/0 675

BIA Bond Number: 788446 44 50/0(,F 3

The attached document is an all inclusive list of the wells operated by Questar Exploration and Production Company. As of

June 14, 2010 QEP Energy Company assumes all rights, duties and obligations as operator of the properties as described on
the list ’

NAME (PLEASEP}N]‘]‘{ Morgan Anderson mme Regulatory Affairs Analyst

@’k;a/k/ \Aﬂds’? fni; / pare 6/23/2010

SIGNATURE

RECEIVED APPROVED _; /341 2009
JUN 2 8 200 s Bl

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) DiViSion ofoﬂ, Ga§ aﬂd Mining
DiV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING Earlene Russell, Engineering Technician



Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)

WONSITS VALLEY
effective June 14, 2010

well_name sec| twp | mg |api entity | mineral |type |stat |C
lease

WV 43 11 | 080S | 210E |4304715471 5265 | Federal | OW [P
WV 48 10 | 080S | 210E |4304715476 5265 | Federal |OW |P
WV 53 10 [ 080S | 210E [4304720003 5265 | Federal |OW |P
WV 55 14 1 080S | 210E |4304720005 5265 | Federal [OW |P
WV 62 10 | 080S | 210E |4304720024 5265 | Federal |OW |P
WV 65 15 | 080S | 210E |4304720041 5265 | Federal |OW |P
WV 83 WG 23 1 080S | 210E |4304720205 17123 | Federal \GW |P
WV 103 14 1 080S | 210E |4304730021 5265 | Federal |OW |P
WV 104 15 [ 080S | 210E 14304730022 5265 | Federal [OW [P
WV 105 10 | 080S | 210E |4304730023 5265 | Federal |OW |P
WV 109 15 1 080S | 210E [4304730045 5265 | Federal |OW |P
WV 110 14 | 080S | 210E 4304730046 5265 | Federal |OW |P
WV1i2 15 | 080S | 210E |4304730048 5265 | Federal |OW |P
WV 124 15 | 080S | 210E |4304730745 5265 | Federal |OW |P
WV 128 10 | 080S | 210E |4304730798 5265 | Federal |OW |P
WV 132 15 | 080S| 210E |4304730822 5265 | Federal |OW [P
WV 136 21 [ 080S | 210E |4304731047 5265 | Federal |OW |S
WV 137 11 | 080S | 210E |4304731523 5265 | Federal  OW |P
(WV 133 15 | 080S | 210E 14304731706 5265 | Federal |OW P
WV 144 10 | 080S | 210E (4304731807 5265 | Federal | OW |P
WV 145 18 | 080S | 220F (4304731820 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 121 14 1 080S | 210E |4304731873 5265 | Federal |(OW (TA
WV 135-2 21 | 080S | 210E |4304732016 5265 | Federal |OW [P
WV 130 22 1 080S | 210E |4304732307 5265 | Federal |OW |P
WV 119 21 1080S| 210E 4304732461 5265 | Federal |OW |P
WV 54 WG 07 | 080S | 220E |4304732821 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 69 WG 18 | 080S | 220E 4304732829 17123 | Federal |GW (P
WV 38 WG 08 | 080S | 220F |4304732831 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 49 WG 08 | 080S | 220E 14304732832 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 138 WG 18 | 080S | 220E 4304733054 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 14 WG 12 | 080S | 210E |4304733070 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 11 WG 12 | 080S | 210E 14304733085 17123 | Federal (GW |P
WV 81 WG 24 1 080S | 210E {4304733086 17123 | Federal |GW |S
WV 146 WG 19 | 080S | 220E 14304733128 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 1W-14-8- 21 14 1 080S | 210E (4304733220 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 5W-13- 8-21 13 | 080S | 210E |4304733221 17123 | Federal |GW (P
WVFU 46 WG 07 | 080S | 220E 4304733241 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 9W-14-8-21 14 | 080S | 210E |4304733269 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 7W-13-8-21 13 | 080S | 210E 4304733270 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 1W-18-8-22 18 | 080S | 220E 4304733294 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 11W-8-8-22 08 | 080S | 220E 14304733295 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 3W-8-8-22 08 | 080S | 220E |4304733493 17123 | Federal |GW IS
WV 5W-7-8-22 07 | 080S | 220E 14304733494 17123 | Federal |GW |S
WV 11W-7-8-22 07 | 080S | 220FE 4304733495 17123 | Federal |GW [P
WV 13W-7-8-22 07 | 080S | 220E 4304733496 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 1W-7-8-22 07 [ 080S | 220E |4304733501 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 3W-7-8-22 07 | 080S | 220E 14304733502 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV TWRG-7-8-22 07 | 080S | 220E 14304733503 5265 | Federal | OW |P
WV 16W-9-8-21 09 [ 080S | 210E {4304733529 17123 | Federal |GW |P

Bonds: BLM = ESB000024
BIA = 956010693
State = 965010695
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Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
WONSITS VALLEY
effective June 14, 2010

well_name sec| twp | g |api entity | mineral |type |stat |C
lease

WV 1W-12-8-21 12 1 080S | 210E |4304733531 17123 | Federal |GW |S
WV 1W-13-8-21 13 1 080S | 210E |4304733532 17123 | Federal |GW |S
WV 3W-18-8-22 18 | 080S | 220E |4304733533 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 9W-12-8-21 12 | 080S | 210E |4304733534 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 11W-12-8-21 12 | 080S | 210E [4304733535 17123 | Federal |GW P
WV 11W-13-8-21 13 [ 080S | 210E |4304733536 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 13W-12-8-21 12 | 080S | 210E |4304733537 17123 | Federal |GW |S
WV 13W-18-8-22 18 | 080S | 220E 14304733538 17123 | Federal | GW |P
WV 16G-9-8-21 09 | 080S | 210E 14304733565 5265 | Federal | OW |P
WV 1W-21-8-21 21 1 080S | 210E 4304733602 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 3W-13-8-21 13 | 080S | 210E |4304733603 17123 | Federal GW |S
WV 3W-22-8-21 22 | 080S | 210E 4304733604 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 3W-24-8-21 24 1 080S | 210E [4304733605 17123 | Federal | GW |P
WV 13W-14-8-21 14 | 080S | 210E 4304733607 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 1W-24-8-21 24 1 080S | 210E 4304733613 17123 | Federal |GW_ |P
WV 11W-18-8-22 18 | 080S | 220E |4304733626 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 2W-10-8-21 10 | 080S | 210E 14304733655 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 4W-11-8-21 11 | 0808 | 210E |4304733657 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 12W-10-8-21 10 | 080S | 210E [4304733659 17123 | Federal |GW |S
WV 12G-10-8-21 10 | 080S | 210E |4304733660 5265 | Federal |OW [P
WV 15W-9-8-21 09 | 080S | 210E 4304733661 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 15G-9-8-21 09 080S| 210E |4304733662 5265 | Federal OW |P
WV 2W-13-8-21 13 1 080S | 210E [4304733791 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 6W-13-8-21 13 | 080S | 210E 4304733792 17123 | Federal | GW |P
WV 8§W-13-8-21 13 | 080S | 210E |4304733793 17123 | Federal |GW [P
WV 10W-1-8-21 01 | 080S | 210E 4304733794 17123 | Federal GW TA
WV 10W-13-8-21 13 1 080S | 210E 4304733795 17123 | Federal |GW [P
WV 12W-7-8-22 07 | 080S | 220F 14304733808 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 6W-8-8-22 08 | 080S | 220E |4304733811 17123 | Federal | GW |P
WV 7W-8-8-22 08 | 080S | 220F |4304733812 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 10W-7-8-22 07 | 080S | 220E |4304733813 17123 | Federal | GW |P
WV 12W-8-8-22 08 | 080S | 220F 4304733815 17123 | Federal |GW P
WV 14W-7-8-22 07 | 080S | 220E |4304733816 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 16W-7-8-22 07 | 080S | 220E |4304733817 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 6W-7-8-22 07 | 080S | 220E 4304733828 17123 | Federal | GW P
WV 6W-18-8-22 18 | 080S | 220E |4304733842 17123 | Federal |GW [P
WV 6WC-18-8-22 18 | 080S | 220F 14304733843 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 6WD-18-8-22 18 | 080S | 220F 4304733844 17123 | Federal \GW |P
WV 5W-23-8-21 23 | 0808 | 210E |4304733860 17123 | Federal | GW [P
WV 7W-23-8-21 23 | 080S | 210E |4304733861 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV §W-12-8-21 12 1 080S | 210E 4304733862 17123 | Federal |GW P
WV 10W-12-8-21 12 | 080S | 210E /14304733863 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 14W-12-8-21 12 | 080S | 210E 14304733864 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 16W-12-8-21 12 | 080S | 210E 14304733865 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 1W-15-8-21 15 | 080S | 210E |4304733902 17123 | Federal |GW |S
WV 1W-22-8-21 22 | 080S | 210E 4304733903 17123 | Federal |GW |S
WV 1W-23-8-21 23 1 080S | 210E 14304733904 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 6W-11-8-21 11 | 080S | 210E |4304733906 17123 | Federal |GW [P
WV 7TW-24-8-21 24 |1 080S | 210E 4304733908 17123 | Federal |GW [P

Bonds: BLM = ESB000024
BIA = 956010693
State = 965010695
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Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Ener

WONSITS VALLEY
effective June 14, 2010

gy Company (N3700)

well_name sec| twp | mg |api entity | mineral |type [stat [C
lease
[WV 10W-11-8-21 11 | 080S | 210E |4304733910 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 11W-15-8-21 15 | 080S | 210E |4304733911 17123 | Federal |GW (P
WV 13W-11-8-21 11 | 080S| 210E |4304733913 17123 | Federal |GW |S
WV 13W-15-8-21 15 1 080S | 210E 4304733914 17123 | Federal |GW (P
WV 15W-10-8-21 10 ] 080S | 210F |4304733916 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 15W-15-8-21 15 | 080S | 210E (4304733917 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 5W-14-8-21 14 | 080S | 210E |4304733953 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 7W-14-8-21 14 | 080S | 210E |4304733955 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 8W-11-8-21 11 | 080S| 210F 4304733957 17123 | Federal |GW |S
WV 8§W-14-8-21 14 | 080S | 210E 4304733958 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 9W-15-8-21 15 | 080S | 210E [4304733959 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 12W-13-8-21 13 | 080S | 210E /4304733961 17123 | Federal | GW |P
WV 14W-13-8-21 13 | 080S | 210E |4304733962 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 15W-14-8-21 14 | 080S | 210E 14304733963 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 2W-18-8-22 18 | 080S | 220F 4304733986 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 8W-18-8-22 18 | 080S | 220E 14304733989 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 10W-18-8-22 18 | 080S | 220E 14304733991 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 12W-18-8-22 18 | 080S | 220E |4304733993 17123 | Federal |GW |[S
WV 14W-18-8-22 18 | 080S | 220F 4304733995 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 8W-1-8-21 01  080S| 210E 4304734009 17123 | Federal (GW |OPS |C
WV 4W-17-8-22 17 | 080S | 220E |4304734038 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 12G-1-8-21 01 | 080S| 210E |4304734108 5265 | Federal | OW |TA
WV 2W-14-8-21 14 |1 080S | 210E |4304734140 17123 | Federal |IGW |P
GH 2W-21-8-21 21 | 080S | 210E |4304734141 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 2W-23-8-21 23 1 080S | 210E 4304734142 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 3W-21-8-21 21 | 080S | 210E (4304734143 17123 | Federal | GW |P
WV 4W-13-8-21 13 | 080S | 210E |4304734144 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 4W-21-8-21 21 1 080S | 210E 14304734145 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 4W-22-8-21 22 | 080S | 210E |4304734146 17123 | Federal | GW |P
WV 16W-11-8-21 11 | 080S| 210E |4304734155 5265 | Federal GW |P
WV 3W-19-8-22 19 | 080S | 220E |4304734187 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 4W-23-8-21 23 | 080S | 210E (4304734188 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 6W-23-8-21 23 1 080S | 210E /4304734189 17123 | Federal |GW |S
WV 2W-15-8-21 15 | 080S | 210E 14304734242 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 2W-22-8-21 22 | 080S | 210F 4304734243 17123 | Federal | GW |P
WV 4W-14-8-21 14 1 080S | 210E |4304734244 17123 | Federal |GW |S
WV 6W-12-8-21 12 | 080S | 210E |4304734245 5265 | Federal GW |TA
WV 7W-15-8-21 15 | 080S | 210E (4304734246 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 8W-15-8-21 15 1080S | 210E |4304734247 17123 | Federal |\GW |P
WV 12W-12-8-21 12 | 080S | 210F (4304734248 17123 | Federal | GW |TA
WV 14W-15-8-21 15 | 080S | 210E |4304734249 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 16W-10-8-21 10 | 080S | 210E 14304734250 17123 | Federal | GW |P
WV 16W-15-8-21 15 | 080S | 210E |4304734251 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 3W-12-8-21 12 | 080S | 210F 14304734267 17123 | Federal [ GW |OPS |C
WV 4D-12-8-21 12 | 080S| 210E |4304734268 17123 | Federal |GW |OPS |C
WV 6W-14-8-21 14 | 080S| 210E [4304734271 17123 | Federal |GW |S
WV 9W-11-8-21 11 | 080S| 210E |4304734274 17123 | Federal |GW |OPS |C
WV 10W-14-8-21 14 | 080S | 210E |4304734275 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 11W-14-8-21 14 1 080S | 210E |4304734277 17123 | Federal |GW [P
Bonds: BLM = ESB000024
BIA = 956010693
State = 965010695 3 of 4




Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)

WONSITS VALLEY
effective June 14, 2010

well_name sec| twp | mg |api entity | mineral |type |stat |C
lease
WV 12W-14-8-21 14 | 080S | 210E 14304734279 17123 | Federal | GW |TA
WV 14M-11-8-21 11 [080S| 210E |4304734280 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 14W-14-8-21 14 | 080S | 210E |4304734281 17123 | Federal |GW |S
WV 16G-14-8-21 14 | 080S | 210F 14304734283 5265 | Federal |OW |P
WV 3MU-15-8-21 15 | 080S | 210E |4304734289 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 4MU-15-8-21 15 | 080S | 210E |4304734291 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 5MU-15-8-21 15 1 080S | 210E |4304734293 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 6W-15-8-21 15 | 080S | 210E |4304734294 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 10W-15-8-21 15 1 080S | 210E /4304734295 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 4W-24-8-21 24 | 080S | 210E |4304734330 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 8§M-23-8-21 23 | 080S | 210E 4304734339 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 8W-24-8-21 24 1080S | 210E 4304734340 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 2W-8-8-22 08 | 080S | 220E |4304734468 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 8§W-7-8-22 07 | 080S | 220F 4304734469 17123 | Federal | GW |S
WV 8§W-22-8-21 22 | 080S | 210E 4304734564 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 14MU-10-8-21 10 | 080S | 210E 14304735879 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 13MU-10-8-21 10 | 080S | 210E |4304736305 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 3D-13-8-21 13 | 080S | 210E |4304737923 17123 | Federal | GW |OPS |C
WV 14DML-12-8-21 12 1 030S | 210E |4304737924 17123 | Federal |GW P
WV 15AML-12-8-21 12 | 080S | 210E 4304737925 17123 | Federal |GW |OPS |C
WYV 13DML-10-8-21 10 1 080S | 210E 14304737926 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 4DML-15-8-21 15 | 080S | 210E 4304737927 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 11AD-14-8-21 14 | 080S | 210E 4304738049 17123 | Federal |GW [P
WV 6-24-8-21 24 1 080S | 210E |4304738663 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 2MI.-24-8-21 24 | 080S | 210E 4304738664 Federal | GW |APD |C
WV 16C-14-8-21 14 | 080S | 210E 4304738737 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 7BML-24-8-21 24 1 080S | 210E /14304738970 Federal |GW |APD |C
WV 7AML-12-8-21 12 | 080S | 210E [4304739035 Federal |GW |APD |C
WV 14BML-12-8-21 12 1 080S | 210E |4304739036 Federal |GW |APD |C
WV 14B-13-8-21 13 | 080S | 210E |4304739037 Federal |IGW |APD |C
WYV 4B-14-8-21 14 | 080S | 210E |4304739038 Federal |GW |APD |C
WV 13A-15-8-21 15 | 080S | 210E 4304739039 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 8D-15-8-21 15 | 080S | 210E |4304739040 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WYV 4BD-23-8-21 23 | 080S | 210E |4304739041 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 7CML-11-8-21 11 | 080S | 210E |4304739042 Federal |GW |APD |C
WV 7BD-23-8-21 23 | 080S | 210E (4304739044 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 2CML-7-8-22 07 | 080S | 220E 14304739155 Federal |GW |APD |C
WV 13AD-8-8-22R(RIGSKID) 08 | 080S | 220E (4304739321 17123 | Federal |GW |P
WV 2B-22-8-21 22 1 080S | 210E 4304740262 Federal | GW |APD |C
WV 8D-22-8-21 22 | 080S | 210E |4304740263 Federal | GW |APD |C
WV 7A-24-8-21 24 [ 080S | 210E 14304740331 Federal |GW |APD |C
Bonds: BLM = ESB000024
BIA = 956010693
State = 965010695 4 of 4




United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT TaKe Pﬁﬁﬁﬁ”
Utah State Office b AM ERICA
P.O. Box 45155 |
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
http://www.blm.gov/ut/st/en.html

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3100
(UT-922)
JUL 8 8 2010
Memorandum
To: Vermal Field Office, Price Field Office, Moab Field Office
From: Chief, Branch of Minerals /Z7A L KW
Subjeét: - Name Change Recognized

Attached is a copy of the Certificate of Name Change issued by the Texas Secretary of State and
a decision letter recognizing the name change from the Fastern States Office. We have updated
our records to reflect the name change in the attached list of leases.

The name change from Questar Exploration and Production Company into QEP Energy
Company is effective June 8, 2010.

cc: MMS
UDOGM

AUG 16 ;7



API Well No: 43047342670000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
UTE

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WV 3W-12-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43047342670000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078

PHONE NUMBER:
303 308-3068 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
0788 FNL 1941 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 12 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
UINTAH

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON
D D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE
SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE
/ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: [ waTer sHuTOFF L] s1TA STATUS EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER

CASING REPAIR

CHANGE WELL NAME

CONVERT WELL TYPE

NEW CONSTRUCTION

OooOoooao

PLUG BACK
(|

D TEMPORARY ABANDON

RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

D WATER DISPOSAL
D APD EXTENSION

OTHER:

No activity on this well during the month of June 2010.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECQRD.QNLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)
Jan Nelson

PHONE NUMBER
435 781-4331

TITLE
Permit Agent

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
7/7/2010

RECEIVED July 07, 2010




API Well No: 43047342670000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
UTE

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WV 3W-12-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43047342670000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078

PHONE NUMBER:
303 308-3068 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
0788 FNL 1941 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 12 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
UINTAH

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON
D D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE
SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE

( DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

7/31/2010

|:| WATER SHUTOFF |:| SI TA STATUS EXTENSION

D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER

CASING REPAIR

CHANGE WELL NAME

CONVERT WELL TYPE

NEW CONSTRUCTION

OooOoooao

PLUG BACK

D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D TEMPORARY ABANDON

D WATER DISPOSAL

D APD EXTENSION

OTHER: l—

No activity on this well during the month of July 2010.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECQRR, ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER

TITLE

Jan Nelson 435 781-4331 Permit Agent
SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 8/3/2010




API Well No: 43047342670000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
UTE

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WV 3W-12-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43047342670000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078

PHONE NUMBER:
303 308-3068 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
0788 FNL 1941 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 12 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
UINTAH

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON
D D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE
SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE

( DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

8/31/2010

|:| WATER SHUTOFF |:| SI TA STATUS EXTENSION

D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER

CASING REPAIR

CHANGE WELL NAME

CONVERT WELL TYPE

NEW CONSTRUCTION

OooOoooao

PLUG BACK

D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D TEMPORARY ABANDON

D WATER DISPOSAL

D APD EXTENSION

OTHER: l—

No activity on this well during the month of August 2010.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECQRR.ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)
Jan Nelson

PHONE NUMBER
435 781-4331

TITLE
Permit Agent

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
9/7/2010

RECEIVED September 07, 2010




API Well No: 43047342670000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
UTE

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WV 3W-12-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43047342670000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078

PHONE NUMBER:
303 308-3068 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
0788 FNL 1941 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 12 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
UINTAH

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

9/30/2010

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS

] SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT

Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON

Ooooooao
O<QoOo0o0oao

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE

D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE

D DRILLING REPORT |:| WATER SHUTOFF |:| SI TA STATUS EXTENSION

Report Date:

D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER

CASING REPAIR

CHANGE WELL NAME

CONVERT WELL TYPE

NEW CONSTRUCTION

OooOoooao

PLUG BACK

D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D TEMPORARY ABANDON

D WATER DISPOSAL

D APD EXTENSION

OTHER: l—

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP Energy Company requests approval to plug and abandon the referenced
well as follows: 1. Cut off the 20" conductor 3' below ground level. 2. Fill up
the 40' of conductor with class G cement and weld on the dry hole marker.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

By

Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: { ™\ Segtember09, 2010

LA LU S

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Jan Nelson 435 781-4331 Permit Agent
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 9/7/2010

RECEIVED September 07, 2010




API Well No: 43047342670000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
UTE

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WV 3W-12-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43047342670000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078

PHONE NUMBER:
303 308-3068 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
0788 FNL 1941 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 12 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
UINTAH

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON
D D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE
SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE

( DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

9/30/2010

|:| WATER SHUTOFF |:| SI TA STATUS EXTENSION

D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER

CASING REPAIR

CHANGE WELL NAME

CONVERT WELL TYPE

NEW CONSTRUCTION

OooOoooao

PLUG BACK

D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D TEMPORARY ABANDON

D WATER DISPOSAL

D APD EXTENSION

OTHER: l—

No activity on this well during the month of September 2010.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORP,ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Jan Nelson 435 781-4331 Permit Agent
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 10/6/2010

RECEIVED October 06, 2010




API Well No: 43047342670000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
UTE

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WV 3W-12-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43047342670000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078

PHONE NUMBER:
303 308-3068 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
0788 FNL 1941 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 12 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
UINTAH

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON
D D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE
SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE
/ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: U] waTER sHUTOFF [ s1TA STATUS EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER

CASING REPAIR

CHANGE WELL NAME

CONVERT WELL TYPE

NEW CONSTRUCTION

PLUG BACK

RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

TEMPORARY ABANDON

OooOooooOononoad

WATER DISPOSAL

|

APD EXTENSION

OTHER: l—

No activity on this well during the month of October 2010.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR REGQRR. ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)
Jan Nelson

PHONE NUMBER

435 781-4331

TITLE
Permit Agent

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
11/2/2010

RECEIVED November 02, 2010




API Well No: 43047342670000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
UTE

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WV 3W-12-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43047342670000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext WONSITS VALLEY
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH
0788 FNL 1941 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 12 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING D CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT D NEW CONSTRUCTION
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
/ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: D WATER SHUTOFF D SI TA STATUS EXTENSION D APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER:

No activity on this well during the month of November 2010.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECOBD@NLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Jan Nelson 435 781-4331 Permit Agent
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 12/2/2010

RECEIVED December 02, 2010




API Well No: 43047342670000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
UTE

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WV 3W-12-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43047342670000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext WONSITS VALLEY
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH
0788 FNL 1941 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 12 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING D CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT D NEW CONSTRUCTION
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
/ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: D WATER SHUTOFF D SI TA STATUS EXTENSION D APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER:

No activity on this well during the month of December 2010.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD@NLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Jan Nelson 435 781-4331 Permit Agent
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 1/10/2011

RECEIVED January 10, 2011




API Well No: 43047342670000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
UTE

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WV 3W-12-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43047342670000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
0788 FNL 1941 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 12 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
UINTAH

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING D CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
/ SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT D NEW CONSTRUCTION
2/3/20 1 1 D OPERATOR CHANGE / PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: D WATER SHUTOFF D SI TA STATUS EXTENSION D APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER:

On February 3, 2011, QEP Energy Company plugged the above mentioned

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

well by filling the conductor pipe from 40' to surface with 65 sacks of cemenccepted by the
cutting off the conductor pipe 3' below ground level, welding on a dry holeUtah Division of

marker and then backfill. Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORDONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Jan Nelson 435 781-4331 Permit Agent
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 2/9/2011




API Well No: 43047342670000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0806

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
UTE

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WV 3W-12-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43047342670000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext WONSITS VALLEY
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH
0788 FNL 1941 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 12 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING D CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT D NEW CONSTRUCTION
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
/ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: D WATER SHUTOFF D SI TA STATUS EXTENSION D APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER:

No activity on this well during the month of January 2011.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORDONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Jan Nelson 435 781-4331 Permit Agent
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 2/7/2011




STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCEES

AMENDED REPORT []
(highlight changes)

FORM 8

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
T 4 N . UTU-0806
‘ R e 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG UTE
1a. TYPE OF WELL: o eas bRy [] OTHER 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME
Wonsits Valley
b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
NEW HORIZ. DEEP- RE- DIFF.
WELL LATS. en L1 ENTRY RESVR. otver P & A WV 3W-12-8-21
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. AP NUMBER:
QEP Energy Company 4304734267
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
11002 E. 17500 S. cry Vernal state UT  z2» 84078 (435) 781-4331 Wonsits Valley
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) 1. QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,
ATsURFAcE: 788" FNL, 1941' FWL '
’ . NENW 12 85 21E S
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVAL REPORTED BELOW:  788' FNL, 1941' FWL
12. COUNTY 13. STATE
ATTOTALDEPTH:  788' FNL, 1941' FWL Uintah UTAH
14. DATE SPUDDED: 15. DATE T.D. REACHED:  |16. DATE COMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, GL):
9/25/2003 2/3/2011 Asanbonep /] resovroproouce [] [ 4968 3' GL
18. TOTAL DEPTH: MD 40 19. PLUG BACK T.D.: MD 20. IF MULTIPLE COMPLETIONS, HOW MANY? * | 21. DEPTHBRIDGE ~ MD
PLUG SET:
TVD TVD b
22. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICAL LOGS RUN (Submit copy of each) 23.
WAS WELL CORED? Nol/]l  ves[]  (submitanalysis)
N/A )
WAS DST RUN? NO YES[ ]  (submitreport
DIRECTIONAL SURVEY? No /] ves[ ]  (submitcopy)
24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in well)
STAGE CEMENTER | CEMENT TYPE & SLURRY
HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE WEIGHT (#/ft) TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) DEPTH NO. OF SACKS | VOLUME (sBL) | CEMENTTOP** [ AMOUNT PULLED
26" 20" 0 40 65
25. TUBING RECORD
SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) | PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTHSET (MD) | PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) | PACKER SET (MD)
26, PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD
FORMATION NAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) TOP(TVD) | BOTTOM(TVD) [ INTERVAL (Top/Bot - MD) SIZE |NO. HOLES PERFORATION STATUS
A) Open D Squeezed D
(B) Open D Squeezed D
C) Open I:I Squeezed D
©) Open D Squeezed D

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL

AMOUNT AND TYPE OF MATERIAL.

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS:

[ ELECTRICALMECHANICAL LOGS

[] suNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGING AND CEMENT VERIFICATION

[J ceoLocic RePORT
[] core anaLysis

[7] ostRrePorT

] orser:

[] DIRECTIONAL SURVEY

30. WELL STATUS:

(56/2000)

(CONTINUED ON BACK)

RECEIVED
FEB 16 201

~nr A=Al 2AS & MINING



31. INITIAL PRODUCTION INTERVAL A (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: ’ HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION |Oit. —BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER ~BBL: |PROD. METHOD:
RATES: —

CHOKE SIZE: |TBG. PRESS. |CSG.PRESS. [APIGRAVITY [BTU-GAS GAS/OIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION [OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER ~BBL: JINTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: =

INTERVAL B (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION |OIL -BBL: GAS — MCF: WATER - BBL: |PROD. METHOD:
RATES: —

CHOKE SIZE:  |TBG. PRESS. |CSG.PRESS. |JAPIGRAVITY |BTU-GAS GAS/OIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION JOIL — BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER —-BBL: |INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: =

INTERVAL C (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION [OIL - BBL: GAS — MCF: WATER -BBL: |PROD. METHOD:
RATES: =

CHOKE SIZE: |TBG. PRESS. |CSG.PRESS. |JAPIGRAVITY |BTU-GAS GAS/OIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION |OIL — BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER -BBL: |INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: =

INTERVAL D (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION |CIL-BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: |PROD. METHOD:
RATES: —
CHOKE SIZE: |TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. ]APIGRAVITY |BTU-GAS GAS/OIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION |OIL - BBL: GAS — MCF: WATER -BBL: |INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: =
32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)
N/A
33. SUMMARY OF POROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION (Log) MARKERS:
Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.
N Top Bottom - Top
Formation (MD) (MD) Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (Measured Depth)
35. ADDITIONAL REMARKS (Include plugging procedure)
36. | hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records.
nme _Permit Agent
oare 211412011
This repprt ghust be submitted within 30 days of
e cofhipleting or plugging a new well ® reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
. ling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore o significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
® nécompleting to a different producing formation e drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM 20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from two or more formations.

**ITEM 24: Cement Top —Show how reported top(s) of cement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL}, cement bond log (CBL), temperature survey (TS)).

Sendto:  Utah Division of Qil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(6/2000)
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