
Fum ateo·s sus-T m impucATE• FORM MPROUSE

µ.lysees) toa.a........sen ORMNO.10060130iDUN TE STATES ,ewesee aMe) Empbe- Febra-y 28,1005

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR S.LEAMESSIONAWONANOSENIALNO.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
UTU-68219

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN
0.!FINDIAN,ALLOTTERORTRIBENAME

9.. Type or w0RK
UTE TRIBAL

DRILL g DEEPEN O T.UINTAGREEMENTNAME

b. TTPS OF WELI.
NIA

OIL GAS SINGLE MULTIPLE 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME, WELL NO.

WELL WELL OTHER 20NE žONS

2. NAME OF OPERATOR
Shenandoah Energy ino. s.ars wBLL NO.

3. ADDRESS Alis TELEPNONE No. Phone: 436-781·4341 11002 East 17800 South
Fax: 438-781-4329 Vernal, Utah 84078 10. FIELE AND POO LOCAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report leestion elaarly and in aseesdamse wMh any State requbements.*)

708' FWi., 2181' FNL, SWNW **.sac..T..n.,m., oR BLK

At prep•••d pr•d. z•=• 20 gg i ANS SURVEY OR AREA

Same SEC. 17, TBS, R21E, SLBAM

14 DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE* 12. COUNTT OR PARISH 13.STATE

19 miles West of Redwash Utah UIntah Utah

15. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED* is. NO. OF ACRES IN LEASE 17. NO. OF e CRES AS$iONED

i.ocATION TO NBAREST ggg. TO TMC WELL

PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE, FT 40
(Abe to messeet ddg. Uma ilme N any)
it. BISTANCE FROM PROPOBBB LOCAWON* 10. PROPOSED DEPTH 20. ROTARY OR CABLETOOLS

TO NEAREST WELL, BRILLING.COMPLETue, 4000' ± 7827' Rotary
omappuse romoN TMS LEASE, FT.

21. ELEVATIONS (Show whenner DF, RT, OR, ete.) 22. APPRox. DATE WORK WILL START*

4688' GR A.S.A.P

sa. paoposse casm0 AND CEMENTRO PROGRAM

REFER TO S.O.P.
Shenandoah Energy ino. proposes to drill a well to 7827' to test the Wasatoh. If produotive,

casing will be run and the well completed. If dry, the well will be plugged and abandoned as per BLM and

State of Utah requirements.

Operation will be according to the Standard Operating Procedures for the Wonsits Valley Federal Unit, Gypsum HIlis Unit and unding

areas for Wasatch wells.

See Onshore Order No. 1 attached.

Please be advised that Shenandoah Energy ino. Is considered to be the operator of the above mentioned well.

Shenandoah Energy Inc. agrees to be responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease for the operations

conducted upon the lease lands. F 3 14 22 1
Bond ooverage for this well is provided by Bond No. 0969. The principal is Shenandoah

Energy inc. via surety as consent as provided for in 43 CFR 3104.2. DMSIO N OF
O!L, CAS AND C:N N3

IN ABOVE SPACE DESORIBM PROPOSED PROORAMs a propes.I h se deepen, give dele en presamt puedmaanse some and propease ...r preemesse mm peepenal b es e- «

..............., ....... ......... .. ........................ ...... - ... Me i peutpresent arpsegemeMg

24

SIGNED John Busch TITLE Red Wash Operations Representative DATE 2/9/01

PERMIT NO. $$ PROVAL DATE

*See Instructions On Reverse Side
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the

United States any false, fictitious or faudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its
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s88 14'w - 39.64 (G.L.O.)

SBB 09 9
WW- 236 .80

( eas.)
S88 12'17"W - 2616.43' (Meas.)

a's's
Sa's'scap s co WELL LOCATION, WV #5W-17-8-21,

LOCATED AS SHOWN IN THE SW 1/4
NW 1/4 OF SECTION 17, T8S, R21E,

d S.L.B.&M. UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH.

HELLLOCA710N:
WVþW-17-8-21 \

\ no
o 708' ELEV UNGRADED GROUND = 4687.9' oz
z N

1967
Brass Cap

1 -

1967
Brass Cap

o THIS IS TO CER OVE PLAT WAS
PREPARED F CTUAL SURVEYS
MADE BY M ION AND THAT
THE SAME AND C THE BEST OF
MY KNOW BdAA377

ooz
I RVE R
S lON 893

1967 1967 1967

Brass Cq Brass Cap Brass Cp N OF
58928'15"W - 2644.74' (Meas.) S88°58'18"W

- 264115' (Meas.) =·

S89 31'W - 40.07 (G.L.O.) S89 56'W - 40.05 (G.L.O.) TRI STATELANDSURVEYING& CONSULTING
38 WEST 100 NORTH - VERNAL,UTAH 84078

(435) 781-2501

LAT/TUDE = 40 07' 28.67" SCALE: 1" = 1000' SURVEYED BY: C.D.S.

= SECTION CORNERS LOCATED
LONG/1UDE = 109 35' 0Z15" DATE: 1-31--01 WEATHER: CO,I,D

BASIS OF ELEV; U.S.G.S. 7-1/2 min QUAD (OURAY SE) DRAWN BY: J.R.S. FILE
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ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Shenandoah Energy Inc.
WV #5W-17-8-21

DRILLING PROGRAM

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore

Federal Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made
with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas No. 1, and the approved
plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy
of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

1. Formation Tops
The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth Prod. Phase Anticipated
Uinta Surface
Green River 2622'
Mahogany Ledge 3412'
Mesa 6127'
TD (Wasatch) 7827' Gas

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil Gas Water and Other Mineral Bearing Zones
The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas. Or
other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation Depth
Oil/Gas Wasatch 7827'

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling, will be
recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested to
determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal, Utah.
Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If no flows are detected,
samples will be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses conducted.

3. Anticipated Bottom Hole Pressures
Maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure equals approximately 3130.8 psi.

4. Surface Ownership
The well pad and access road are located on lands owned by the Ute
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The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas. Or
other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation Depth
Oil/Gas Wasatch 7827'

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling, will be
recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested to
determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal, Utah.
Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If no flows are detected,
samples will be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses conducted.

3. Anticipated Bottom Hole Pressures
Maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure equals approximately 3130.8 psi.

4. Surface Ownership
The well pad and access road are located on lands owned by the Ute
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Lessee's or Operator's Representative:

John Busch
Red Wash Operations Rep.

Shenandoah Energy Inc.
11002 East 17500 South

Vernal, Utah 84078
(435) 781-4341

Certification:

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil & Gas Orders, the approved
plan of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees.

Shenandoah Energy Inc. will be fully responsible for the actions of their subcontractors.

A complete copy of the approved Application for Permit to Drill will be furnished to the
field representative(s) to ensure compliance and shall be on location during all
construction and drilling operations.

I hereby certify that I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the
proposed drill site and access route; that I am familiar with the conditions which currently
exist; that the statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and
correct; and that the work associated with the operations proposed herein will be
performed by Shenandoah Energy Inc. its' contractors and subcontractors in conformity
with this plan and the terms and conditions under which it is approved. This statement is
subject to the provisions of 18 U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.
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WORKSHEET
LICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRIL

I O

APD RECEIVED: 02/14/2001 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-33954

WELL NAME: WV 5W-17-8-21

OPERATOR: SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC ( N4235 )

CONTACT: JOHN BUSCH PHONE NUMBER: 435-781-4341

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
SWNW 17 080S 210E

SURFACE: 2151 FNL 0708 FWL Tech Review Initials Date

BOTTOM: 2151 FNL 0708 FWL Engineering
UINTAH

UNDESIGNATED ( 2 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 1- Surface

LEASE NUMBER: UTU-68219

SURFACE OWNER: 2 -T AL

PROPOSED FORMATION: WSTC

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

g/ Plat R 9-2-3. Unit

v/ Bond: FedkÍ] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[] R649-3-2. General
390. UT-0969 ) Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

Potash (Y/N) R649-3-3. Exception
1 Shale (Y/N) *190-5 (B) or 190-3

Drilling UnitWater Permit
090. 43-8496 ) Board Cause No:

RDCC Review (Y/N)
Eff Date:

(Date:
Siting:

Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:
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State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210

Michael O. Leavitt PO Box 145801Governor
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Kathleen Clarke
Executive Director 801-538-5340

Lowell P. Braxton 801-359-3940(Fax)
Division Director 801-538-7223(TDD)

February 22, 2001

Shenandoah Energy, Inc.
11002 E 17500 S
Vernal, UT 84078

Re: Wonsits Valley 5W-17-8-21 Well, 2151' FNL, 708' FWL, SW NW, Sec. 17, T. 8 South,
R. 21 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et seq., Utah
Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous
operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date. The API
identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-33954.

Sincerely,

ohn R. Baza
Associate Director

er
Enclosures
cc: Uintah County Assessor

Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District
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Operator: Shenandoah Energy, Inc.
Well Name & Number Wonsits Valley 5W-17-8-21

API Number: 43-047-33954
Lease: UTU-68219

Location: SW NW Sec. 17 T. 8 South R. 21 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to

Operator: Shenandoah Energy, Inc.
Well Name & Number Wonsits Valley 5W-17-8-21

API Number: 43-047-33954
Lease: UTU-68219

Location: SW NW Sec. 17 T. 8 South R. 21 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to

Operator: Shenandoah Energy, Inc.
Well Name & Number Wonsits Valley 5W-17-8-21

API Number: 43-047-33954
Lease: UTU-68219

Location: SW NW Sec. 17 T. 8 South R. 21 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to

Operator: Shenandoah Energy, Inc.
Well Name & Number Wonsits Valley 5W-17-8-21

API Number: 43-047-33954
Lease: UTU-68219

Location: SW NW Sec. 17 T. 8 South R. 21 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to



Form .A SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE* 'M APPROVED
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' DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5.LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNO.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT UTU-68219

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN 0.!FINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

is. TYPE OF WORK UTE TRIBAL

DRILL [i] DEEPEN 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF WELL
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WELL WELL OTHER z0NE ZONE
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4. I.ocATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and In accordance with any State requirements.*)
WONSITS VALLEY

7
Fœ

L, 2151' FNL, SWNW E IVED
11.SEC.,T.,R.,M., OR BLK

AStproposedprod.zon AN RC
, R21E, SLB&M

14. DiBTANCE IN MELESAND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE* 12. COUNTY OR PARISH 13.STATE

19 miles West of Redwash Utah Ulntah Utah
15. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED* 16. NO. OF ACRES IN LEASE 17. NO. OF i CRES ASSIGNED
LOCATION TO NEAREST 708' ± To ime wsu.
PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE, FT. 880 40
(Alee te nearest deig. Unit ilme if any}

sa. DiBTANCE FROM PROPOSED LOCATION* 10. PROPOSED DEPTH 20. ROTARY OR CABLE TOOLS
TO NEAREST WELL, DRILLING,COMPLETeo, 4000' ± 7827' Rotary
OR APPLIED FOR ON THis LEASE, FT.

21. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 22. APPROX. DATE WORK WILL START*

4688' OR A.S.A.P
23. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

REFER TO S.O.P.
Shenandoah Energy inc. proposes to drill a well to 7827' to test the Wasatch. If productive,

casing will be run and the well completed. If dry, the well will be plugged and abandoned as per BLM and
State of Utah requirements.

Operation will be according to the Standard Operating Procedures for the Wonsits Valley Federal Unit, Gypsum HIlis Unit and surrounding
areas for Wasatch wells.

See Onshore Order No. 1 attached.

Please be advised that Shenandoah Energy Inc. Is considered to be the operator of the above mentioned well.
Shenandoah Energy inc. agrees to be responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease for the operations
conducted upon the lease lands.

Bond coverage for this well is provided by Bond No. 0969. The principal is Shenandoah
Energy Inc. via surety as consent as provided for in 43 CFR 3104.2.

IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBM PROPOSED PROGRAM: If peepenal is te deepen, give data em presamt preemenen some and prep.eed meer preemeuse sema. Er pampamai in to dem er

deepen direstiemm-y, give partiment data en subeariano lesagema and maammares and true waruumi depths. eine Mewest presenter program if any.

24

SIGNED John Busch TITLE Red Wash Operations Representative DATE 2/9/01

APPROVALDAT, NOTICEOFAPPROVAL
Applientlem approval does met warrant er oortMy that the appileamt holds legal er equitable title to these rights in the subjeet lease whieb weald entitle the appNemat te sendast operations thereen.
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

½sistant Field Manager
APPROVED BY TITLE Sneral 96SOUTCOS gay,

APR 1 9 2001

*See Instructions On Reverse Side
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the

United States any false, fictitious or faudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
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Form .A SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE* 'M APPROVED
1902) UNITEDs)TES '°*"gg'"

,''*ga.
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Well No.: WV5W-17-8-21

CONDITIONSOF APPROVAL
APPLICATION FOR PERMITTO DRILL

Company/Operator: Shenandoah Enerqy Inc.

WellName & Number: WV SW-17-8-21

API Number: 43-047-33954

Lease Number: U-68219

Location: SWNE Sec. _17 T.8S_R. 21E

Agreement: None

For more specific details on notificationrequirements, please check the Conditions of Approval

for Notice to Drilland Surface Use Program.

CONDITIONSOF APPROVAL

Approval of this applicationdoes not warrant or certifythat the applicant holds legal or equitable

title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicantto conductoperations
thereon.

Be aware fire restrictionsmay be in effectwhen location is being constructedand/orwhenwell

is being drilled. Contact the appropriate Surface Management Agency for information.

DRILLINGPROGRAM

As a minimum,the usablewater resources shall be isolated and/or protected by having

a cement top behind the production casing at least 200' above the base ofthe usable

water zone identified at ±1880'.

Coring, Loqqinq and Testing Program

Dailydrillingand completion progress reportsshall be submitted to this office on a

weekly basis.

Other Information

In the event after-hours approvals are necessary, you mustcontactone ofthe following
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WellNo.: WV5W-17-8-21

Ed Forsman (435) 789-7077 (HOME) (435) 646-1685 (PAGER)
Petroleum Engineer

KirkFleetwood (435) 789-6858 (HOME) (435) 646-1678 (PAGER)
Petroleum Engineer

Jerry Kenczka (435) 781-1190 (HOME) (435) 646-1676 (PAGER)
Petroleum Engineer

BLMFAXMachine (435)
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WellNo.: WV5W-17-8-21

SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONSOF APPROVAL(COAs)

Shenandoah Energy, INC.(Shenandoah) willassure the Ute Tribe that anylallcontractorsand
subcontractorshave acquireda currentTribalBusiness License and have updated "Access
Permits" prior to construction. All Shenandoah personnel, contractors and subcontractors will

have these permits in theirvehicles at all times. Companies that have not compliedwiththis
COAwillbe in violationofthe Ute Tribal Business License Ordinance, and willbe subject to
fines and penalties.

Shenandoah employees,representatives, and/orauthorizedpersonnel (subcontractors) shall

not carry firearms on their person or in theirvehicles whileworking on the Uintah and Ouray

fndian Reservation.

Shenandoah employeesand/orauthorizedpersonnel (subcontractors)in the fieldwillhave

approvedapplicableAPDs and/or ROW permitslauthorizations on theirperson(s) during all

phases of construction.

Shenandoah willnotifythe Ute Tribe and Bureau of Indian Affairs(BIA)in writingof any
requested modificationof APDs or Rights-OfWay (ROW). Shenandoah shall receivewritten

notificationof authorizationor denial ofthe requested modification.Without authorization,

Shenandoah willbe subjectto fines and penalties.

The Ute Tribe Energy & Minerals Department shall be notifiedinwriting48 hours in advanceof

any construction activity. The Ute Tribal office is open Monday throughThursday. A Tribal

Technician is to routinely monitorconstruction. Shenandoah shall makearrangementswith the

Ute Energy & Minerals Department for allmonitoringthat willexceed regular workinghours for

TribalTechnicians. A qualified Archaeologist accompanied by a TribalTechnician will
monitorany trenchingrequired for the construction of the pipeline. Shenandoah is to inform

contractorsto maintainconstructionofthe pipelines withinapproved rightofways.

Shenandoah shall maintain cattleguardsand fence integrityas originallyconstructedfor any

access roads or pipeline routes which cross the Ute Indian Reservation BoundaryFence.

A corridor ROW, 30 feet wide, shall be granted for the access road/pipeline corridor and a

ROW,30 feet wide, shallbe granted for the remainder of the pipeline. The constructedtravel

width of the access road willbe limited to 18 feet. Upon authorization by the Ute Tribe Energy

& Minerals Department, the ROW may be widerwhere sharp curves; deep cuts and fills occur;

or, where intersections.with other roads are required.

Upon completionofthe pertinent APD and ROWs, Shenandoah willnotifythe Ute Tribe Energy

& Minerals Department for a TribalTechnician to verifythe Affidavit of Completion. Wheneach

pipeline has been constructed and completed as builtdescriptions willbe filedwith the Ute

Tribal Energy and Minerals Department.

Production waters, oil,and other byproducts shall not be placed on access roads or the well
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ROW,30 feet wide, shallbe granted for the remainder of the pipeline. The constructedtravel

width of the access road willbe limited to 18 feet. Upon authorization by the Ute Tribe Energy

& Minerals Department, the ROW may be widerwhere sharp curves; deep cuts and fills occur;

or, where intersections.with other roads are required.

Upon completionofthe pertinent APD and ROWs, Shenandoah willnotifythe Ute Tribe Energy

& Minerals Department for a TribalTechnician to verifythe Affidavit of Completion. Wheneach

pipeline has been constructed and completed as builtdescriptions willbe filedwith the Ute

Tribal Energy and Minerals Department.

Production waters, oil,and other byproducts shall not be placed on access roads or the well
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Allvehicular traffic,personnel movement,construction and restoration operations willbe
confinedto the areas examinedand approvedand to the existing roadways and/or evaluated
access routes.

Shenandoah willimplement "Safety and Emergency Plan" and ensure plan compliance.

Shenandoah shall stop construction activities and notifypersonnel from the Ute Tribe Energy &

Minerals Department and BIAifculturalremains including paleontologic resources (vertebrate

fossils) are exposed or identifiedduring construction.The Ute Tribe Department of Cultural

Rights and Protection and the BIAwillprovide mitigationmeasures prior to allowing
construction.

Shenandoah employees and/or authorizedpersonnel (subcontractors)willnot be allowedto
collectartifactsand paleontologic fossils. No significantcultural resources shall be disturbed.

Shenandoah willcontrolnoxiousweeds on the wellsite and ROWs. Shenandoah willbe
responsible for noxious weed controlifweeds spread from the project area onto adjoiningland.

Reserve pits willbe lined with an impervious syntheticliner. About 17 rods of fence willbe
constructedaroundthe reserve pituntilit is backfilled. Prior to backfillingthe reserve pit, alf
fluidswillbe pumped from thepit into trucksand hauled to approveddisposal sites. When the
reserve pits are backfilled,the surplus oiland mud,etc., willbe buried a minimumof 3 feet

below the surface of the soil.

A closedsystem willbe used during production. This means that production fluids will be

containedin leak-proof tanks. AIIproduction fluidswillbe disposed of at approved disposal

sites.

Surface pipelines willbe constructedto lay on the soilsurface. The ROWwillnot be bladed or

cleared of vegetation withoutauthorizationofthe BIA. Surface pipelines shall be welded in

place at well sites or on access roads. They shall be pulled into place with suitable equipment.
Vehicle use shallbe kept withinthe access road/pipeline corridorROWor on existing approved

roads unless specificallyauthorized.

Before the site is abandoned, Shenandoah willbe requiredto restore the well site and ROWs to

near theiroriginalstate. The disturbed areas willbe reseeded withdesirable perennial

vegetation.

Soil erosionwill.bemitigatedby reseeding alldisturbed
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t 9) UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November30, 2000
5. Lease SerialNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-68219
Do not use this form for proposals to drIll or to re-enter an

abandoned well. Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. 6. I InEdi All or Tribe Name

SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. I UAnitor CA/Agreement, Nameand/or No.

1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.
O Oil Well O Gas Well O Other WONSITS VALLEY5W 17 8 21

2. Name of Operator Contact: ANN PETRIK 9. API Well No.
SHENANDOAHENERGY INC. E-Mail:apetrik@shenandoahenergy.com 43-047-33954

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH Ph: 435.781.4306 WONSITS VALLEY
VERNAL,UT 84078 Fx: 435.781.4329

4. Locationof Well (Footage,Sec., T.,R., M., or SurveyDescription) 11. County or Parish, and State

Sec 17 T8S R21E SWNW 2151FNL 708FWL UINTAHCOUNTY, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Acidize O Deepen O Production (Start/Resume) O Water Shut-Off0 Notice of Intent
0 Alter Casing O Fracture Treat 0 Reclamation O Well Integrity

B SubsequentReport 0 Casing Repair O New Construction O Recomplete B Other
Well Spud0 Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon

0 Convert to Injection 0 Plug Back O Water Disposal
13. Describe Proposed or CompletedOperation (clearly state all pertinent details,includingestiinated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.If the proposal is to deependirectionally or recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days

following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiplecompletion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, includingreclamation, have been completed, and the operator hasdeterminedthat the site is ready for final inspection.)

THIS WELLWAS SPUD 10/03/01. DRILL12 1/4" HOLE TO 476'. RUN 11 JTS 9 5/8 CASING TO 466.

RECEIVED
OCT12 2001
DIVISION OF

OIL, GAS AND MINING
l ereby e that the foregoingis true d correc

ectronic ubmission #7702 verifies by the BLMWell Information System
or SHENANDOAH ENEREY INC., sent to the Vernal

N (Print d/Typed) ANN PETRIK Title ADMINISTRATIVECONTACT

Signature (Electronic Submission) Date 10/05/2001

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Apgoved By Title Date

Conditionsof approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicantholds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Office
Title 18U.S.C. Section 1001and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212,make it a crime for any personknowinglyand willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the United

States any false, fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

" ORIGINAL" ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL" ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL " ORIGINAL"
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State of Utah OPERATOR ACCT. No. J-/2 3 à

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining OPERATOR: Shenandoah Energy, Inc.
UU 1 I UL I i L ADDRESS: 11002 East 17500 South

ENTITYACTION FORM - FORM 6 Vernal, Utah 84078-8526 (801)781-4300

Action Current New Entity API Number Well Name QQ SC TP RG | County Spud Date Effective Date
Code Entity No. No. |

A 43-047-33954 WV SW 17 8 21 SWNW 17 8S 21E Uintah 10/03/01

WELL 1 COMMENTS:
New well to be drilled in Wonsits Valley. Not in the Wasatch participatingarea. /d - /A - o /

WELL 2 COMMENTS:

I I I I
WELL 3 COMMENTS:

WELL 4 COMMENTS:

I I I ' I I
WELL 5 COMMENTS:

TION CODES (See instructions on back of form)
A - Establish new entityfor new well (singlewellonly)
B - Add new wellto existing entity(groupor unitwell)
C - Re-assign wellfrom one existingentityto another existingentity ign ure
D - Re-assign wellfrom one existingentityto a new entity
E - Other (explain in comments section) Administrative Assistant: 10/05/01

Title Date
NOTE: Use COMMENT section to explainwhy each Action Code was selec

Phone No. (801) 781-4306

OIL. G
NNDOM
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UU 1 I UL I i L ADDRESS: 11002 East 17500 South
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9) MAITED STATES FORM APPROVED

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires:November30, 2000
5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-68219
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an

abandoned well. Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. 6. I InEdi 1 or Tribe Name

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement,Name and/orNo.
N/A

1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.
WONSITS VALLEY5W 17 8 21

0 Dil Well 8 Gas Well O Other
2. Name of Operator Contact: ANN PETRIK 9. API Well No.

SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC. E-Mail:apetrik@shenandoahenergy.com 43-047-33954

3a. Address 3b. PhoneNo. (includearea code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH -- Ph: 435.781.4306 WONSITS VALLEY
VERNAL, UT 84078 Fx: 435.781.4329

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or SurveyDescription) 11. County or Parish, and State

Sec 17 TSS R21E SWNW 2151FNL 708FWL UINTAHCOUNTY, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Acidize O Deepen O Production (Start/Resume) O Water Shut-Off
0 Notice of Intent

0 Alter Casing O Fracture Treat O Reclamation O Well Integrity
S SubsequentReport O Casing Repair O New Construction O Recomplete g Other

O Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon 0 Temporarily Abandon Production Start-up

0 Convert to Injection O Plug Back O Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, includingestimated starting date of any proposed work and approximatedurationthereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depths of all pertinentmarkers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performedor provide the BondNo. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequentreports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiplecompletion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

THIS WELL COMMENCED PRODUCTION 11/12/01.

14. I hereby certi at the foregoing is true and .

Ele onic ubmission #9064 verifiet by the BLM Well Information System
or SHENANDOAH ENER Y INC., sent to the Vernal

am gye4/Typed) ANN PETRIK Title ADMINISTRATIVECONTACT

Signature (Electronic Submission) Date 11/16/2001

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Apgoved By Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Office

any departrnent or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL " ORIGINAL " ORIGINAL"
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** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL " ORIGINAL " ORIGINAL"



Form3I60-4 UNITED STATES FORM APPkuvED(August 1999) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004-0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November30.2000

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG 5. Lease Serial No.
UTU-68219

la. Type of Well O Oil Well Gas Well O Dry O Other 6 If Indian. Allottee or Tribe Nameb. Type of Completion g New Well O workover O Deepen O Plug Back O Diff Resvr
Other T Uml or CA Agreement Name and No

UTU68219
2. Name of Operator Contact: JT CONLEY s Lease Name and well NoSHENANDOAH ENERGY INC E-Mail: jconley@shenandoahenergy.com WV 5W-17-8-21
3. Address 11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH 3a. Phone No melude area code) 9 APl M ell No.VERNAL, UT 84078 Ph. 435.7814300 43-047-33954
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with Federal requiremenis) 10. Field and Pool. or Exploratory

UNDESIGNATEDAt surface SWNW 2151FNL 708FWL
11. Sec., T., R., M., or Block and Survey

At top prod interval reported below SWNW 2151FNL 708FWL or Area Sec 17 T8S R21E Mer SLB
12. County or Parish 13. StateAt total depth SWNW 2151FNL 708FWL UINTAH UT

14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16. Date Complete 17. Elevations (DF, KB, RT, GL)*10/03/2001 10/29/2001 OD & A @ Ready to Prod. 4688 GL
11/10/2001

18. Total Depth: MD 7850 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 7795 20. Depth Bridge Plug Sei Ml)TVD T\'D

SPECTRAL DENSITY HIRES INDUCTlON; BL-VDL- //--/3-C/ Was DST run" O Yes (subnut aimais
Direcitonal Survey" No O YeMSuhnni andvsm

23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings sei in well)

Hole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#/ft.) Top Bottom Slage Cementer No. of Sks. & Siurry 901.
Cement Top* Amouni Pulled(MD) (MD) Depth Type of Cement (BBL)

12.250 9.625 K-55 36.0 0 466 175 0
7.875 4.500 J-55 11.6 0 7850 1125 990

24. Tubing Record

Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD)2.375 7510
25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record

Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf Status
A) WASATCH 7386 7664 7386 TO 7392 OPEN
B) 7396TO7410 OPEN
C) 7444TO7452 OPEN
D) 7644 TO 7664 OPEN27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc. VEDDepth Interval Amount and Type of Matenal

7386 TO 7452 SAND FRAC WITH 140,500 LBS IN 54,800 GALS
7644 TO 7664 SAND FRAC WlTH 60,000 LBS IN 28,400 GALS

DjylylON OF28.Production-Interval A
GAS AND MININGDate First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water OiÌ Gravity Gas Production McLhodProduced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

11/12/2001 11/14/2001 24 5.0 698.0 10.0 FLOWS FROM WELL
Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas:Oil Well SlalusSize FIwg. 290 Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

48/64 SI 525.0 PGW
28a. Production - Interval B

Date First Test Hours Test Gil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production MethodProduced Date Tested Product on BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas:Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

(SeeInstructions and spaces for additional data on reverse side)
ELECTRONIC SUBMISSION #10210 VERIFIED BY THE BLM WELL INFORMATION SYSTEM

** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL
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** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL
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C) 7444TO7452 OPEN
D) 7644 TO 7664 OPEN27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc. VEDDepth Interval Amount and Type of Matenal

7386 TO 7452 SAND FRAC WITH 140,500 LBS IN 54,800 GALS
7644 TO 7664 SAND FRAC WlTH 60,000 LBS IN 28,400 GALS

DjylylON OF28.Production-Interval A
GAS AND MININGDate First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water OiÌ Gravity Gas Production McLhodProduced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

11/12/2001 11/14/2001 24 5.0 698.0 10.0 FLOWS FROM WELL
Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas:Oil Well SlalusSize FIwg. 290 Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

48/64 SI 525.0 PGW
28a. Production - Interval B

Date First Test Hours Test Gil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production MethodProduced Date Tested Product on BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas:Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

(SeeInstructions and spaces for additional data on reverse side)
ELECTRONIC SUBMISSION #10210 VERIFIED BY THE BLM WELL INFORMATION SYSTEM

** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL

Form3I60-4 UNITED STATES FORM APPkuvED(August 1999) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004-0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November30.2000

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG 5. Lease Serial No.
UTU-68219

la. Type of Well O Oil Well Gas Well O Dry O Other 6 If Indian. Allottee or Tribe Nameb. Type of Completion g New Well O workover O Deepen O Plug Back O Diff Resvr
Other T Uml or CA Agreement Name and No

UTU68219
2. Name of Operator Contact: JT CONLEY s Lease Name and well NoSHENANDOAH ENERGY INC E-Mail: jconley@shenandoahenergy.com WV 5W-17-8-21
3. Address 11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH 3a. Phone No melude area code) 9 APl M ell No.VERNAL, UT 84078 Ph. 435.7814300 43-047-33954
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with Federal requiremenis) 10. Field and Pool. or Exploratory

UNDESIGNATEDAt surface SWNW 2151FNL 708FWL
11. Sec., T., R., M., or Block and Survey

At top prod interval reported below SWNW 2151FNL 708FWL or Area Sec 17 T8S R21E Mer SLB
12. County or Parish 13. StateAt total depth SWNW 2151FNL 708FWL UINTAH UT

14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16. Date Complete 17. Elevations (DF, KB, RT, GL)*10/03/2001 10/29/2001 OD & A @ Ready to Prod. 4688 GL
11/10/2001

18. Total Depth: MD 7850 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 7795 20. Depth Bridge Plug Sei Ml)TVD T\'D

SPECTRAL DENSITY HIRES INDUCTlON; BL-VDL- //--/3-C/ Was DST run" O Yes (subnut aimais
Direcitonal Survey" No O YeMSuhnni andvsm

23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings sei in well)

Hole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#/ft.) Top Bottom Slage Cementer No. of Sks. & Siurry 901.
Cement Top* Amouni Pulled(MD) (MD) Depth Type of Cement (BBL)

12.250 9.625 K-55 36.0 0 466 175 0
7.875 4.500 J-55 11.6 0 7850 1125 990

24. Tubing Record

Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD)
2.375 7510

25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf Status

A) WASATCH 7386 7664 7386 TO 7392 OPEN
B) 7396TO7410 OPEN
C) 7444TO7452 OPEN
D) 7644 TO 7664 OPEN27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc. VEDDepth Interval Amount and Type of Matenal

7386 TO 7452 SAND FRAC WITH 140,500 LBS IN 54,800 GALS
7644 TO 7664 SAND FRAC WlTH 60,000 LBS IN 28,400 GALS

DjylylON OF28.Production-Interval A
GAS AND MININGDate First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water OiÌ Gravity Gas Production McLhodProduced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

11/12/2001 11/14/2001 24 5.0 698.0 10.0 FLOWS FROM WELL
Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas:Oil Well SlalusSize FIwg. 290 Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

48/64 SI 525.0 PGW
28a. Production - Interval B

Date First Test Hours Test Gil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production MethodProduced Date Tested Product on BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas:Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

(SeeInstructions and spaces for additional data on reverse side)
ELECTRONIC SUBMISSION #10210 VERIFIED BY THE BLM WELL INFORMATION SYSTEM

** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL



28b. Production - Interval C
Dale First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Producuon Method
Produced Dale Tested ProducLion BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Presa. Usg. 24 Hr Uti Gas WaLer Gas:Oll Well Stalus
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

28c. Production - Interval D
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas:Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

29. Disposition of Gas(Sold, used forfuel,vented, etc.)
SOLD

30. Summaryof Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all importantzones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervalsand all drill-stem
tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures
and recoveries.

Top
Formation Top Bottom Descriptions,Contents, etc. Name

Meas. Depth

WASATCH 7386 7392 CHANNEL SAND GREEN RIVER 2622
WASATCH 7396 7410 CHANNEL SAND MAHOGANY 3377
WASATCH 7444 7452 CHANNEL SAND WASATCH 6132
WASATCH 7644 7664 CHANNEL SAND

CONFlDENTIAL

RECEIVEu
32. Additional remarks (include plugging procedure):

CONFIDENTIAL - TITE HOLE
Do not release well information without permission from Shenandoah Energy Inc FEB0 5 2002

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND MUNG

33. Circle enclosed attachments:
1. Electrical/MechanicalLogs (1 full set req'd.) 2. GeologicReport 3. DST Report 4. Directional Survey

5. SundryNotice for plugging and cement verification 6. Core Analysis 7 Other:

34. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached informationis complete and correct as determinedfrom all available records (see attached instructions):

Electronic Submission #10210 Verified by the BLM Well Information System.
- For SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC, sent to the Vernal

Name(pleasepring J.T. CONLEY Tille DIVISION MANAGER

Signature (Electronic Submission) Date 01/28/2002

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency
of the United States any false, fictitious or fradulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL " ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL
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Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency
of the United States any false, fictitious or fradulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
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STATE OF UTAH
: ss AFFIDAVIT OF COMPLETION

COUNTY OF UINTAH

I, John Busch being first duly sworn, say that I am the Project Supervisor of
Wonsits Valley SW-17-8-21 and that the right-of-wayissued under the Grant of
Easement #H62-2001-311 has been constructed under my supervision and
includes the wellsite, pipeline, and access road across a portion of the Ute Indian
Tribal Lands. This construction began on April 17, 2001 and was completed on
May 31, 2001, this right-of-way does not materially deviate from the approved
plans, notes, and maps filed February 12, 2001.

Project Representative

Subscribed and sworn to before me this day, March 26, 2001

RALEEË8EARLE Raleen Searle
i NOTARY PUBLIC

e, IVlycommission expires June, 2004

CERTIFICATE
I, J.T. Conley do hereby certify that I am a representative for Shenandoah
Energy Inc. hereafter designated the "Grantee"; and that John Busch who
subscribed the"foregoing affidavit, is employed by the "Grantee"; that in their
construction of the Wonsits Valley 5W-17-8-21 it does not deviate from the
approved plans, notes, and maps filed February 12, 2001 and that the "Grantee"
has in all things complied with the requirements of the act of February 5, 1948,
and all applicable regulations pursuant to which the "Grantee" has been granted
the right-of-way.

"Grant '

APR g 2002

DIVOFOIL,GAS&
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Carol Daniels - xls.shenlogs.xis Page 2

43 047 34144 WV 4W 13-8-21 COMPENSATED DENSITY NEUTRON, ARRAY INDUCTION
43 047 33954 WV 5W 17-8-21 Tog f.f/h S~/f SPECTRAL DENSITY, HIRES INDUCTION
43 047 34246 WV 7W 15-8-21 CBL
43 047 34065 WV 7W 36-7-21 HR INDUCTION
43 047 34456 WV 10W 5-8-22 CBL
43 047 34279 WV 12W 14-8-21 MECH SCT
43 047 34251 WV 16W 15-8-21 CBL-VDL

43 047 33662 WVFU 15G 9-8-21 COMP NEUTRON DENS, ARRAY IND, MECH CORING
43 047 33602 WVFU 1W 21-8-21 CBL-VDL
43 047 33613 WVFU 1W-24-8-21 SPECTRAL DENSITY, DUAL LATERLOG
43 047 33603 WVFU 3W-13-8-21 SPECTRAL DENSITY, DUAL LATERLOG, CBL-VDL
43 047 33957 WVFU 8W-11-8-21 CBL-VDL
43 047 33793 WVFU 8W-13-8-21 CBLIGR
43 047 33269 WVFU 9W-14-8-21 SPECTRAL DENSITY, DUAL LATERLOG
43 047 33795 WVFU 10W-13-8-21 DIPOLE SONIC, CBL
43 047 33626 WVFU 11W-18-8-22 CBL-VDL
43 047 33606 WVFU 13W-13-8-21 DIPOLE SONIC, CBL-VDL
43 047 33607 WVFU 13W-14-8-21 DIPOLE SONIC, COMP NEUTRON
43 047 33645 WVFU 16W-2-8-21 DUAL
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Carol Daniels - xls.shenlogs.xis Page 1

DATE: 12/184002

SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC

Logs not received for wells completed

API NUMBER WELL NAME LOGS NEEDED

43 047 34122 GB 7W 25-8-21 COMP NEUTRON TLIGR, ARRAY INDUC WILC-GR

43 047 34531 GB 7W 30-8-22 COMP NEUTRON-DENSITY, ARRAY INDUCTION, CBL-VDL

43 047 34532 GB 8W 30-8-22 COMPENSATED NEUTRON TLD
43 047 34533 GB 9W 30-8-22 DIPOLE SONIC IMAGER COMP ENUTRON GR, CBL
43 047 33754 GB 11W 16-8-22 SPECTRAL DENSITY DSN, HRI
43 047 34039 GB 11W 20-8-22 COMP NEUTRON TL/GR, ARRAY INDUCWILC-GR

43 047 34327 GH 1W 20-8-21 MECHSIDEWALL CRG TOOL
43 047 33848 GH 15W 21-8-21 SPECTRAL DENSITY, DUAL LATERLOG

43 047 34573 OU GB 1W 29-8-22 CMT VOL, Al WILC-GR, COMP NEUTRON TLD
43 047 34546 OU GB 3W 29-8-22 SPECTRAL DENSITY DSN
43 047 34549 OU GB 5W 29-8-22 MECHSDWLL CRG TL
43 047 34554 OU GB 14W 29-8-22 SECTOR BOND LOG, SPECTRA SCAN IMA

43 047 33591 RWU 12-24A SPECTRAL DENSITY, HIRES INDUCTION
43 047 33766 RWU 22-29B SPECTRAL DENSITY, HIRES INDUCTION
43 047 33567 RWU 23-24A SPECRAL DENSITY, HIRES INDUCTION
43 047 33788 RWU 31-30B CBL-VDL

43 047 33771 RWU 42-30B CBL-VDL

43 047 34006 WR 14W 4-8-22 MUD LOG

43 047 34106 WV 3G 10-8-21 CBL-VDL

43 047 34390 WV 15G 5-8-22 DIPOLE SONIC IMAGER - GRICCL
43 047 34243 WV 2W 22-8-21 HIRES
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From: Carol Daniels
To: raleen.searle@questar.com
Subject: Requesting logs for wells that have been completed

Hi Raleen,

I am attaching a list for logs we have not received for wells that have been completed. Any questions,
please call me at 801-538-5284.

Thank you and have a Merry Christmas and a Happy New
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH
. CDW

..

3. FILE

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent/Operator

X Operator Name Change Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 2/1/2003
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N4235-Shenandoah Energy Inc N2460-QEP Uinta Basin Inc

11002E 17500S 11002E 17500S
Vernal, UT 84078-8526 Vernal, UT 84078-8526

Phone: (435) 78 l -434 1 Phone: (435) 78 1-434 1

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)
NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL conre

NO TYPE TYPE STATUS

WV $W-11-8-Žì $7 0808 210E 430473395 13332 Federal GW P
WV 7W-17-8-2l 17 080S 210E 4304733956 13330 Federal GW P
GHU 14W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304733915 13073 Federal GW . P
GH 9W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733846 13074 Federal GW P
GH 11W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733847 13049 Federal GW P
GH 15W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733848 13051 Federal GW P
WV 9W-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304733909 13160 Federal GW P
GB 9W-25-8-21 25 080S 210E 4304733960 , 13390 Federal GW P
WV 1W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733985 13369 Federal GW P
WV 3W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733987 13321 Federal OW S
WV 7W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733988 13235 Federal GW P
WV 9W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733990 13238 Federal GW P
WV 11W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733992 13239 Federal GW P
WV 13W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733994 13236 Federal GW P
WV 15W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733996 13240 Federal GW P
WV 8W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734005 13220 Federal GW P
GB 9W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304733946 , 13393 Federal GW P
GB 12W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304733948 , 13388 Federal GW P
GB 4W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304733945 13372 Federal GW P
GB 10W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304733947 13389 Federal GW P

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2003

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2003

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/19/2003

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 5292864-015 I

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

OEP LJB2 FORM
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6. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: 7/21/2003

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 7/21/2003

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,
for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: n/a

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 8/27/2003

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 8/27/2003

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: n/a
, .

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on:
- a

STATE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965-0034)3L

FEDERAL WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 9654)02-976

INDIAN WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION: ·
-

·

1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 799446

FEE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965-003-033

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
The Division sent response by letter on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS:

QEP UB 2 FORM
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uestar Exploration and Production Company
inOd5e0ple7ndheSncreeetl,

uite 500

Denver, CO 80265
Tel 303 672 6900 • Fax 303 294 9632

Denver Division

May 28, 2003

Division of Oil, Gas, & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P. O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Attention: JohnBaza/JimThompson

Gentlemen:

This will serve as notice that through the internal corporate changes described below,
activities formerly conducted in the name of either Shenandoah Operating Company, LLC
(SOC) and/or Shenandoah Energy, Inc. (SEI) will hereafter be conducted in the name of
QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.: i) the Shenandoah entities were purchased in July,2001 by Questar
Market Resources, Inc., which is a mid-level holding company for the non-utility businesses
of QuestarCorporation, ii) Shenandoah Operating Company, LLC has now been merged
into Shenandoah Energy, Inc. (SEI), iii) Shenandoah Energy, Inc. has now been re-named

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. pursuant to a State of Delaware Amended and Restated Certificate
of Incorporation, iv) the same employees will continue to be responsible for operations of
the former SOC and SEI properties, both in the field and in the office. Accordingly, the
change involvesonly an internal corporate name change and no third party change of
operator is involved. Please alter your records to reflect the entity name change. Attachedis
a spreadsheet listing all wells affected by this change.

Should you have any questions, please call me at 303 - 308-3056.

Yours truly,

rank Nielsen
Division Landman

Enclosure RECEl VED
JUNO2 2003

DM OF OL GAS &
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SEI(N4235)toCIEP(N2460)

well name Sec T R api Entity ase Type
UTAH STATE 1 36 070S 240E 4304715128 5878 State
BRENNANFED3 17 070S 210E 4304715419 10750 Federal
FEDEILAL2-29-7-22 29 070S 220E 4304715423 5266 Federal
FS PRINCE GOVT l 10 070S 240E 4304716199 7035 Federal
KAYE STATE 1-16 16 100S 230E 4304730609 5395 State
LEOTA FED 1 34 070S 210E 4304730879 5420 Federal
GULFBRENFLANFED8 17 070S 210E 4304731509 5290 Federal
RFC 1 20 070S 210E 4304731805 10952 Federal
EAST COYOTE FED 14-4-8-25 04 080S 250E 4304732493 11630 Federal
FSPRINCE4 03 070S 240E 4304732677 7035 Federal
GYPSUh4 HILLS21 21 080S 210E 4304732692 11819 Federal
TOLL STATION ST 8-36-8-21 36 080S 210E 4304732724 12361 State
SAGE GROUSE FED 6-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304732746 11944 Federal
GYPSUtdHILLS229/G 22 080S 210E 4304732818 12336 Federal
GLENBENCHST8A-36-8-21 36 080S 210E 4304733037 12377 State
GLENBENCHST6-36-8-21 36 080S 210E 4304733038 12378 State
SAGE GROUSE 12A-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304733177 12524 Federal
CRJCH3123W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304733249 13488 Fedenal
GLEN BENCH ST 2-36-8-21 36 080S 210E 4304733252 12527 State
CH3U15-1:8-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733364 12690 Fedend
GLEN BENCH FED 3W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304733513 12950 Federal
GLEN BENCH FED 5W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304733514 12873 Federal
VVVFED 9M'-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733515 13395 Fedend
GB FED 9M'-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733516 12997 Fedenal
OU GB3\V-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304733526 13514 Fedend
CulU 109V-19-8-21 19 080S 210E 4304733528 12736 Fedend
CHIla'-32-8-21 32 080S 210E 4304733570 12797 Sutte
Cui 3M'-32-8-21 32 080S 210E 4304733571 12796 Sutte
GH 53W-32-8-21 32 080S 210E 4304733572 12828 Sutte
GiHTW'-32-8-21 32 080S 210E 4304733573 12872 Sutte
GLENBENCH 12M'-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304733670 13380Federal
GH 2M'-32-8-21 32 080S 210E 4304733744 13029 Sutte
GiH44'-32-8-21 32 080S 210E 4304733745 13035 SMLÍ€
GH BM'-32-8-21 32 080S 210E 4304733746 13030 State
GB3\V-16-8-22 16 080S 220E 4304733751 13577 Suite -

GB 53¥-16-8-22 16 080S 220E 4304733752 13570 State
CHi6'W-32-8-21 32 080S 210E 4304733753 13036 Suite
GB lln'-16-8-22 16 080S 220E 4304733754 13582 Sutte
GH 71N-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733845 13050 Feden11
GH 99¥-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733846 13074 Fedenal
GH llMI-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733847 13049 Fedend
GH 159/-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733848 13051 Fedend
GH 5G-32-8-21 32 080S 210E 4304733866 13037 State
VVV93¥-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304733909 13160 Fedenal
GHU linV-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304733915 13073 Fedenal
GB in'-36-8-21 36 080S 210E 4304733944 13439 Suite
CH360¥-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304733945 13372 Federal
GB 93W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304733946 13393 Fedenal
GB 10M'-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304733947 13389 Federal
GB 12\V-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304733948 13388 Fedend
WV 5W-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304733954 13332 Federal
VVV7M'-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304733956 13330 Fedenal
GR396W-25-8-21 25 080S 210E 4304733960 13390 Fedenil
VVV1M'-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733985 13369 Fedenal
VVV3M'-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733987 13321 Federal
VVV7'N-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733988 13235 Fedend
VVV9'N-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733990 13238 Fedenal
VVV11M'-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733992 13239 Fedend
VVV133W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733994 13236 Fedenal
WV 15W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733996 13240 Federal
VVVBM'-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734005 13220 Federal
YVV143¥-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734007 13322 Federal
CRJ GB 6¾'-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734018 13518 Federal
GB SM'-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734025 13502 Fedenil
GB 11W'-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734039 13413 Federal
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GLENBENCH 12M'-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304733670 13380Federal
GH 2M'-32-8-21 32 080S 210E 4304733744 13029 Sutte
GiH44'-32-8-21 32 080S 210E 4304733745 13035 SMLÍ€
GH BM'-32-8-21 32 080S 210E 4304733746 13030 State
GB3\V-16-8-22 16 080S 220E 4304733751 13577 Suite -

GB 53¥-16-8-22 16 080S 220E 4304733752 13570 State
CHi6'W-32-8-21 32 080S 210E 4304733753 13036 Suite
GB lln'-16-8-22 16 080S 220E 4304733754 13582 Sutte
GH 71N-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733845 13050 Feden11
GH 99¥-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733846 13074 Fedenal
GH llMI-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733847 13049 Fedend
GH 159/-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733848 13051 Fedend
GH 5G-32-8-21 32 080S 210E 4304733866 13037 State
VVV93¥-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304733909 13160 Fedenal
GHU linV-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304733915 13073 Fedenal
GB in'-36-8-21 36 080S 210E 4304733944 13439 Suite
CH360¥-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304733945 13372 Federal
GB 93W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304733946 13393 Fedenal
GB 10M'-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304733947 13389 Federal
GB 12\V-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304733948 13388 Fedend
WV 5W-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304733954 13332 Federal
VVV7M'-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304733956 13330 Fedenal
GR396W-25-8-21 25 080S 210E 4304733960 13390 Fedenil
VVV1M'-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733985 13369 Fedenal
VVV3M'-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733987 13321 Federal
VVV7'N-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733988 13235 Fedend
VVV9'N-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733990 13238 Fedenal
VVV11M'-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733992 13239 Fedend
VVV133W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733994 13236 Fedenal
WV 15W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733996 13240 Federal
VVVBM'-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734005 13220 Federal
YVV143¥-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734007 13322 Federal
CRJ GB 6¾'-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734018 13518 Federal
GB SM'-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734025 13502 Fedenil
GB 11W'-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734039 13413 Federal
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DU GB49V-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734043 13520 Federal
YVV7M'-36-7-21 36 070S 210E 4304734065 13334 State
YVV93¥-36-7-21 36 070S 210E 4304734066 13331 State
YVV3G-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304734106 13241 Federal
YVV15Gi-3-8-21 03 080S 210E 4304734109 13368 Fedeml
YVV16G-3-8-21 03 080S 210E 4304734110 13295 Fedenal
GB 63¥-25-8-21 25 080S 210E 4304734121 13440 Fee
GB 9"A'-25-8-21 25 080S 210E 4304734122 13436 Fee
GH 5M'-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734147 13387 Fedend
Cai6M'-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734148 13371 Fedend
GH 8M'-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734149 13293 Fedend
GH 99V-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304734150 13392 Fedenal
GH 10M'-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734151 13328 Fedend
GH 109/-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734152 13378 Fedend
GH 12M'-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734153 13294 Fedeml
0 i 149V-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734154 13292 Fedend
004 lénV-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304734156 13354 Fedend
GH 163W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734157 13329 Fedend
003 5'N-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734209 13414 Fedend
YVV63¥-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304734272 13379 Fedenal
Edi ln'-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734327 13451 Fedenal
End 2'N-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734328 13527 Fedend
GH 3M'-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734329 13728 Fedenal
Gül 73W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734332 13537 Fedend
CUi 93¥-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734333 13411 Fedend
GJi 114'-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734334 13410 Fedenal
GH 153¥-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734335 13407 Fedend
Cal lénV-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734336 13501 Fedend
VVV123¥-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304734343 13430 Fedend
OU GB 13\V-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734348 13495 Fedend •

CRJGB 14M'-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734349 13507 Fedend
CRJCH311W'-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734350 13526 Fedend
VVV11Gi-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734388 13422 Fedend
VVV13G-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734389 13738 Fedend
VVV15G-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734390 13459 Fedend
GB 11\V-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734392 13433 Fee
SU BRENNAN W 15W-18-7-22 18 070S 220E 4304734403 13442 Federal
STIRRUP U 16W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734446 13654 Federal
STIRRUP U 2W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734455 13700 Federal
VVV10AV-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734456 13540 Fedend
VVV163W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734470 13508 Fedend
GB 169VX-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734506 13431 Fedend
CRJ GiB liW-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734512 13469 Fedend
CRJCH32\V-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734513 13461 Fedend
OU GB 5\V-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734514 13460 Fedeml
CRJ GB 73¥-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734515 13462 Fedenal
CRJGB 83¥-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734516 13489 Fedend
CRJ GB lin'-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734517 13467 Fedend
CRJ GB 16M'-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734522 13476 Fedenal
CH3l\V-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734528 13487 Fedeml
GiB3\V-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734529 13493 Fedeml
GB 6\V-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734530 13519 Fedenal
GB 7M'-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734531 13494 Fedenal
GB 83¥-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734532 13483 Fedend
GB 9\V-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734533 13500 Fedeml
CRJGB6\V-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734534 13475 Fedend
CRJ GB 10\V-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734535 13479 Fedend
CRJ GB 13\V-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734536 13478 Fedend
CRJ GB 14\V-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734537 13484 Fedend
CRJ GB 15M'-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734538 13482 Federal
OU GB 12\V-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734542 13543 Fedend
OU GB 6W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734543 13536 Federal
04J GB 133W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734544 13547 Fedend
CRJGB 63¥-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734545 13535 Federal
CRJ GB3\V-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734546 13509 Federal
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CRJGB 13M'-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734547 13506 Fedem1 '
CRJ GB4\V-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734548 13534 Fedenal
CRJ GB 5\V-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734549 13505 Fedend
CRJGB 149V-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734550 13550 Federal
CRJ GB llw'-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734553 13671 Fedend
CRJGB 14\V-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734554 13528 Federal
CRJGB 29¥-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734559 13539 Federal
CRJGB 7\V-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734560 13599 Federal
GH E>CT15\V-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304734562 13674 Fedeml
CTUGB 16\V-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304734563 13559 Fedend
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JUL0 Y2003
3104 (932.34)WF
Nationwide Bond ESBOOOO24

NOTICE

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. : Oil and Gas
1050 17* Street Suite 500 : lease
Denver, Colorado 80265 :

Name Change Recognized

Acceptable evidence has been filed in this office concerning the name change of Shenandoah
Energy Incorporated into QEP Uinta Basin, Incorporated. QEP Uinta Basin, Incorporated is the
surviving entity. This name change is recognized effective April 17, 2003.

Eastern States will notify the Minerals Management Service and all applicable Bureau of Land
Management offices of the change by a copy of this notice.

If you identify other leases in which the merging entity maintain an interest, please contact this
office and we will appropriately document those files with a copy of this notice.

If you have any questions, please contact Bill Forbes at 703-440-1536.

Wilbert B. Forbes
Land Law Examiner

Branch of Use Authorization
Division of Resources Planning,

Use and Protection

bc: JFO,MMS, ES RF, 930 RF, 932.34 RF, E-932: wbf:07 /07/03:440-1536/ QEP Unita
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United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City,UT 84145-0155

In Reply Refer To:
3106
(UT-924)

July 21, 2003

Memorandum

To: ernal Field Office

From: Chief, Branch of Minerals Adjudication

Subject: Name Change Approval

Attached is an approved copy of the name change from BLM-Eastern States, which is recognized
by the Utah State Office. We have updated our records to reflect:

The name change from Shenandoah Energy Incorporated into QEP Uinta Basin, Incorporated is
effective July 23, 1999. The BLM Bond Number is ESB000024.

Acting Chief, Branch of
Minerals Adjudication

Enclosure
1. Eastern States Letter
2. List of leases

cc: MMS, James Sykes, PO Box 25165, M/S 357 B1, Denver CO 80225
State of Utah, DOGM, Earlene Russell (Ste. 1210), Box 145801, SLC UT 84114
Teresa Thompson (UT-922)
Joe Incardine (UT-921)

RECEIVED
JUL2 9 2003

DIV.OF OIL,GAS&
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Exhibit of Leases

UTSL-065342 UTU-0825 UTU-65472 UTU-74971
UTSL-065429 UTU-0826 UTU-65632 UTU-74972
UTSL-066409-A UTU-0827 UTU-67844 UTU-75079
UTSL-066446 UTU-0828 UTU-68217 UTU-75080
UTSL-066446-A UTU-0829 UTU-68218 UTU-75081
UTSL-066446-B UTU-0830 UTU-68219 UTU-75082
UTSL-066791 UTU-0933 UTU-68220 UTU-75083
UTSL-069330 UTU-0971 UTU-68387 UTU-75084
UTSL-070932-A UTU-0971-A UTU-68620 UTU-75085
UTSL-071745 UTU-01089 UTU-69001 UTU-75086
UTSL-071963 UTU-02025 UTU-70853 UTU-75087
UTSL-071964 UTU-02030 UTU-70854 - UTU-75088
UTSL-071965 UTU-02060 UTU-70855 UTU-75102

UTU-02148 UTU-70856 UTU-75103
UTU-046 UTU-02149 UTU-71416 UTU-75116
UTU-055 UTU-02510-A UTU-72066 UTU-75243
UTU-057 UTU-09613 UTU-72109 UTU-75503
UTU-058 UTU-09617 UTU-72118 UTU-75678
UTU-059 UTU-09809 UTU-72598 UTU-75684
UTU-080 UTU-011225-B UTU-72634 UTU-76278
UTU-081 UTU-011226 UTU-72649 UTU-7¾60
UTU-082 UTU-011226-B UTU-73182 UTU-75939
UTU-093 UTU-012457 UTU-73443 UTU-76039
UTU-0116 UTU-012457-A UTU-73456 UTU-76482
UTU-0558 UTU-018260-A UTU-73680 UTU-76507
UTU-0559 UTU-022158 UTU-73681 UTU-76508
UTU-0560 UTU-025960 UTU-73684 UTU-76721
UTU-0561 UTU-025962 UTU-73686 UTU-76835
UTU-0562 UTU-025963 UTU-73687 UTU-77063
UTU-0566 UTU-029649 UTU-73698 UTU-77301
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. DJJ

2F
Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 1/1/2007

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2460-QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. N5085-QuestarE&P Company

1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265

Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900 Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900

CA No. Unit: GYPSUM HILLS UNIT
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

NO TYPE STATUS
SEE ATTACHED LISTS *

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 4/19/2007

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 4/16/2007
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 1/31/2005

4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143

Sa. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: n/a

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 4/23/2007 BIA

7. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 4/23/2007

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on:

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on:

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 799446
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965003033

3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS: THIS IS A COMPANY NAME CHANGE.
SOME WELL NAMES HAVE BEEN CHANGED AS REQUESTED

Questar E&P FORM A.xis 4/30/2007 AND
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1 of 2 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
GYPSUM HILLSUNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q l SEC | TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

GDCPSIINIHIIJLS3 GII3 NENH 20 I 080S 210E 4304720002 5355 Federal TVI A
(ifPSLDAHDLLS4 GII4 STVSE 19 !080S 210E 4304730028 5355 Federal ONV P
G3CPSlÏ¾IHILLS6 GH6 NEbPN i 20 080S 210E 4304730099 5251 Federal VVI A
CX3STikSFED1-.20-z‡B GH 1-20 FRESVV 20 080S 210E 4304731006 5355 Federal TVI A
WHITON FED 1-19-3C GH 1-19 SESE 19 080S ':210E 4304731065 5355 Federal OW P
COSTAS FED 2-20-3B GH 2-20 NESE 20 080S | 210E 4304731066 5355 Federal WI A
STAGECOACH FED 23-21 GH 23-21 NWSW 21 080S | 210E 4304731541 5355 Federal OW P
COSTAS FED 3-21-lD GH 3-21 SWNW 21 080S 210E 4304731604 i 5355 Federal WI A
COSTAS FED 4-21-IC GH 4-21 SENW 21 080S 210E 4304731826 5355 Federal OW P
CX3STikSFED5-21-2C GH5-21 SETTE 21 080S 210E 4304731827 5355 Federal CTW7 P
SPJJ8-I GBJ8-I SYVfDB 20 080S 210E 4304731932 5355 Federal YVI A
GYPSUM HILLS 9 GH 9 SENE 20 080S 210E 4304732304 5355 Federal OW P
GPfPSIlhdllILI?; 10 GHI 10 NVISE 21 080S 210E 4304732306 5355 Federal NVI A
CTYPSUlvlHILLS 12 GH12 knESE L9 080S 210E 4304732458 5355 Federal TVI A
(3Ÿl SLnviFDIALS11 Gill 11 PINVSE 20 080S 210E 4304732459 5355 Fedend ()?V P
GPfPSilhdEIL1-S 13 Gill 13 >U¯STV 21 080S 210E 4304732460 5355 Federal ()NV P
GYPSUM HILLS 14 GH 13 NWSW 20 080S 210E 4304732647 5355 Federal OW P
GiYPS.UhfHIIALS15 GH 15 SVVSTV 20 080S 210E 4304732648 5355 Fedend TVI A
GifPSLTW1HIIJUS17 GH 17 STVSE 20 080S 210E 4304732649 5355 Fedend SNT 4
GYPSUM HILLS 18 GH 18 SESE 20 080S 210E 4304732650 5355 Federal OW P
CifPSUM1HILLS 19 GH19 SV FB¥ 20 080S 210E 4304732651 5355 Federal ¡ONV P
GYPSUM HILLS 20 GH 20 SENW 20 080S 210E 430473_2652 5355 Federal OW P
GYPSUM HILLS 16 GH 16 SESW 20 080S 210E 4304732675 5355 Federal OW P
GHU 10W-19-8-21 GH 10W-19-8-21 NWSE I 19 080S 210E 4304733528 12736 Federal GW P
GII 1013-19-8-21 Gli 10N3-19-8-.21 fivVSE 19 080S 210E 4304733566 5355 Federal ()97 P
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GYPSUM HILLS 13ÌIG-17-8-21 GHX 13HG-17-8-21 SWSW 17 · 080S 210E 4304734723 5355 Federal OW S
ÕH lG-17-8-21 GH lG-17-8-21 NENE 17 i 080S 210E 4304734927 5355 Federal OW P
WV EXT 2W-17-8-21 WVX 2W-17-8-20 NWNE 17 080S 210E 4304734928 14253 Federal |GW P
WV EXT 8W-17-8-21 WVX 8W-17-8-20 SENE 17 080S 210E 4304734929 13792 |Federal GW P
GH 4MU-20-8-21 GH 4MU-20-8-21 NWNW 20 080S 210E 4304735068 14213 Federal GW P
GYPSUM HILLS 13MU-20-8-21 GH 13MU-20-8-20 SWSW i 20 080S 210E 4304735070 14817 Federal GW P
GH 5W-20-8-21 GH SW-20-8-21 SWNW
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1 of 2 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
GYPSUM HILLSUNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q l SEC | TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

GDCPSIINIHIIJLS3 GII3 NENH 20 I 080S 210E 4304720002 5355 Federal TVI A
(ifPSLDAHDLLS4 GII4 STVSE 19 !080S 210E 4304730028 5355 Federal ONV P
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CX3STikSFED5-21-2C GH5-21 SETTE 21 080S 210E 4304731827 5355 Federal CTW7 P
SPJJ8-I GBJ8-I SYVfDB 20 080S 210E 4304731932 5355 Federal YVI A
GYPSUM HILLS 9 GH 9 SENE 20 080S 210E 4304732304 5355 Federal OW P
GPfPSIlhdllILI?; 10 GHI 10 NVISE 21 080S 210E 4304732306 5355 Federal NVI A
CTYPSUlvlHILLS 12 GH12 knESE L9 080S 210E 4304732458 5355 Federal TVI A
(3Ÿl SLnviFDIALS11 Gill 11 PINVSE 20 080S 210E 4304732459 5355 Fedend ()?V P
GPfPSilhdEIL1-S 13 Gill 13 >U¯STV 21 080S 210E 4304732460 5355 Federal ()NV P
GYPSUM HILLS 14 GH 13 NWSW 20 080S 210E 4304732647 5355 Federal OW P
GiYPS.UhfHIIALS15 GH 15 SVVSTV 20 080S 210E 4304732648 5355 Fedend TVI A
GifPSLTW1HIIJUS17 GH 17 STVSE 20 080S 210E 4304732649 5355 Fedend SNT 4
GYPSUM HILLS 18 GH 18 SESE 20 080S 210E 4304732650 5355 Federal OW P
CifPSUM1HILLS 19 GH19 SV FB¥ 20 080S 210E 4304732651 5355 Federal ¡ONV P
GYPSUM HILLS 20 GH 20 SENW 20 080S 210E 430473_2652 5355 Federal OW P
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GH EXT 15W-17-8-21 GHX 15W-17-8-20 SWSE 17 . 080S 210E 4304734562 13674 Federal GW P
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2 of 2 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
GYPSUM HILLSUNIT

OriginalWellName Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease WellType Status

GH 1ML-19-8-21 GH IML-19-8-21 NENE 19 080S 210E i 4304735324 14824 ·Federal GW P
GH 16W-19-8-21 GH 16W-19-8-21 SESE 19 080S 210E , 4304735325_ 14823 IFederal GW DRL
WVX 14MU 17-8-21 WVX 14MU 17-8-21 SESW 17 080S 210E 4304735369 14098 :Federal GW P
WVX 12MU-17-8-21 WVX 12MU-17-8-21 NWSW 17 080S 210E 4304735370 15108 ,Federal GW P
WVX 8MU-19-8-21 WVX 8MU-19-8-21 _ ______

SENE 19 080S 210E . 4304735372 14241 |Federal GW P
GH 10ML-18-8-21 GH 10ML-18-8-21 NWSE 18 080S 210E : 4304735391 15482 IFederal GW P
GE 8G-17-8-21 GH 8G-17-8-21 SENE _ 17 080S 210E 4304737992 5355 Federal OW DRL
GH 16G-17-8-21 GH 16G-17-8-21 SESE 17 080S 210E 4304737993 5355 :Federal OW iDRL
WVX 1MU-17-8-21 WVX IMU-17-8-21 NENE 17 080S 210E ' 4304738156 |Federal GW APD
GH 8MU-20-8-21 GH 8-20-8-21 SENE 20 080S 210E 4304738157 |Federal GW APD
WVX 13MU-17-8-21 WVX 13MU-17-8-21 SWSW 17 080S | 210E 4304738188 Federal GW APD
WVX 6MU-l7-8-21 WVX 6MU-17-8-21 SENW 17 080S

,
2l0E 4304738189 Federal GW APD

WVX 4MU-17-8-21 WVX 4MU-17-8-21 NWNW 17 080S : 210E 4304738190 Federal GW APD
WVi 16MU-18-8-21 WVX 16MU-Ï8ÀÃl SESE 18 080S 210E 4304738191 '

Federal GW APD
GH 2MU-19-8-21 GH 2MU-19-8-21 NWNE 19 080S i 210E 4304738192 Federal GW APD
GH 3MU-19-8-21 GH 3MU-19-8-21 NENW 19 080S | 210E 430Ã738250 Federal GW APD
GH 4MU-19-8-21 GH 4MU-19-8-21 NWNW 19 080S 210E 4304738264 Federal GW APD
GH 5MU-19-8-21 GH 5MU-19-8-21 SWNW 19 080S 210E 4304738265 Federal GW APD
GH 6MU-19-8-21 GH 6MU-19-8-21 SENW 19 080S 210E 430Ã738266| Federal .GW APD
GH7MU-19-8-21 IGH7D-19-8-21 SWNE ! 19 080S 210E 4304738267 | Federal GW APD
GH llMU-19-8-21 IGH 11MU-19-8-21 NESW : 19 080S 210E 4304738268 Federal GW APD
GH 12MU-19-8-21 IGH 12MU-19-8-21 NWSW I 19 080S 210E 4304738269 Federal GW APD
GH 15MU-19-8-21 ,GH 15MU-19-8-21 SWSE 19 080S 210E 4304738270 IFederal GW APD
GH 14MU-19-8-21 GH 14MU-19-8-21 SESW 19 080S 210E 4304738472 Federal GW APD
WVX lMU-18-8-21 IWVX 1MU-18-8-21 NENE | 18 080S 210E 4304738659 iFederal GW APD
WVX 9MU-18-8-21 WVX 9MU-18-8-21 NESE ; 18 080S 210E 4304738660 Federal GW APD
WVX 8MU-18-8-21 GH 8G-18-8-21 SENE 18 080S 210Ë 4304738661 Federal !GW APD
GH 6MU-20-8-21 GH 6-20-8-21 SENW 20 080S 210E 4304738662 ŸederalIGW

2 of 2 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
GYPSUM HILLSUNIT

OriginalWellName Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease WellType Status
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,
2l0E 4304738189 Federal GW APD
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GH llMU-19-8-21 IGH 11MU-19-8-21 NESW : 19 080S 210E 4304738268 Federal GW APD
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WVX lMU-18-8-21 IWVX 1MU-18-8-21 NENE | 18 080S 210E 4304738659 iFederal GW APD
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2 of 2 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
GYPSUM HILLSUNIT

OriginalWellName Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease WellType Status
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WVX 4MU-17-8-21 WVX 4MU-17-8-21 NWNW 17 080S : 210E 4304738190 Federal GW APD
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GH 12MU-19-8-21 IGH 12MU-19-8-21 NWSW I 19 080S 210E 4304738269 Federal GW APD
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STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

see attached
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 FINDIAN AcLhLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do notuse thisform for proposals to drillnewwells, significantlydeepen existingwella below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drillhorizontal laterale. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT 70 DRILLform forsuch proposals See attached

1. TYPE OF WELL 6. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL O OTHER see attached
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR 9.APINUMBER.
QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANY attached

3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1050 17th Street Suite 500 Denver s, CO ,80265 (303) 308-3068

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: attached COUNTY: Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

a CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

1/1/2007 CHANGE TO PREVIOUSPLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of workcompletion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHEn: Operator Name
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Change

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED ORCOMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearlyshowallpertinentdetails Including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective January 1, 2007 operator of record,QEP Uinta Basin, Inc., willhereafter be known as QUESTAR EXPLORATION
AND PRODUCTION COMPANY. This name change involves only an Internal corporate name change and no thirdparty
change ofoperator is involved. The same employeeswillcontinueto be responsible for operations ofthe properties described
on theattached list. AIIoperationswillcontinueto be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLMReference No. ESBOOOO24)
Utah State Bond Number: 965003033
Fee Land Bond Number: 965003033
Current operator of record, QEP UINTABASIN,INC , hereby r signs as operatorof the properties as described on the
attached list.

Ja es , Executive Vice President, QEP UInta Basin, Inc.
Successor operator of record, QUESTAR EXPLORATIO blD PO UCTIONCOMPANY, hereby assumes all rights, duties
and obligationsas operator of the propertles as descr ed on the ttachedlist

Jayf. Neese, Exec tiveVice President
Questar Exploration and Production Company

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) D a K. ,Stanberry ; ) TITLE Supervlsor,Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATURE '
DATE 3/16/2007

(This space for Stato use only)

RECE"!E
APRI S 2007

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side)
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
see attached

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS see attached
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do not use thisform for proposals to drillneW wells, significantly deepen existingwells beloW Current bottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, orto see attacheddrill horizontal laterals Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals,

1 TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER see attached
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANY attached

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:
1050 17th Street Suite 500 Denver _ CO 80265 (303) 308-3068

4 LOCATioN OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE attached coUNTY; UIntah

QTR/QTR, BECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
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TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION[¯]
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(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTOREPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

1/1/2007 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR
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12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show allpertinentdetalls Including dates, depths, volumes,etc.

PER THE ATTACHEDLIST OF WELLS, QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANYREQUESTS THATTHE
INDIVIDUALWELL NAMES BE UPDATED IN YOUR RECORDS.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) /) , TITLE Supervisor, Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATURE 4/17/2007

(This apaoo for Stato use only)
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APR13 2007(See instructions on Reverse Side)
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1 TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER see attached
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANY attached

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:
1050 17th Street Suite 500 Denver _ CO 80265 (303) 308-3068

4 LOCATioN OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE attached coUNTY; UIntah

QTR/QTR, BECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION[¯]

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATECURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTOREPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

1/1/2007 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFFDate ofworkcompletion:
COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS REGLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Well Name Changes
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show allpertinentdetalls Including dates, depths, volumes,etc.

PER THE ATTACHEDLIST OF WELLS, QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANYREQUESTS THATTHE
INDIVIDUALWELL NAMES BE UPDATED IN YOUR RECORDS.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) /) , TITLE Supervisor, Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATURE 4/17/2007

(This apaoo for Stato use only)

RECEIVED
APR13 2007(See instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV.OFOlL,GAS&MINING
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't United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Roe a Utah State Office TAKE Pmon'
P.O. Box 45155 NgM ERICA

Salt Lake City,UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
UT-922

April23, 2007

Questar Exploration and Production Company
1050 17th Street, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265

Re: Gypsum Hills (GR) Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

On April 12, 2007, we received an indenture dated April 6, 2007, whereby QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
resigned as UnitOperator and Questar Exploration and Production Company was designated as
Successor UnitOperator for the Gypsum Hills (GR) Unit,Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unitagreement. The instrument is hereby approved effectiveApril23, 2007.
In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the

designated party has obtained all required approval that wouldentitle it to conduct operations under
the Gypsum Hills (GR) Unit Agreement.

Your nationwideoiland gas bond No. ESBOOOO24willbe used to cover allfederal operations within
the Gypsum Hills (GR) Unit.

It is requested that you notify all interested parties of the change in unit operator. Copies of the
approvedinstruments are being distributedto the appropriatefederaloffices,with one copy returned
herewith.

Sincerely,

Is/ Greg J. Noble

Greg J. Noble
Acting Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure
bcc: Field Manager - Vernal (wlenclosure)

SITLA
Division of Oil,Gas &Mining
File - Gypsum Hills(GR)Unit(wlenclosure)
Agr. Sec. Chron 20
Reading File
Central Files APR30 2001

UT922:TAThompson:tt:4/23/07
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/14/2010

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N5085-QuestarExploration and Production Company N3700-QEP Energy Company

1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265

Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048 Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048

CA No. Unit: GYPSUM HILLS (GRRV)
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

NO TYPE STATUS
SEE ATTACHED

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/28/2010
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/28/2010
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/24/2010
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Requested
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 8/16/2010 BIA not yet
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 8/16/2010
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 6/29/2010
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/30/2010
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/30/2010
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESBOOOO24
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965010693
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965010695
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a
COMMENTS:

QEP Energy (Gypsum Hills GRRV) FORM A.xls

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/14/2010
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NO TYPE STATUS
SEE ATTACHED
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8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
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9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 6/29/2010
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/30/2010
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/30/2010
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COMMENTS:

QEP Energy (Gypsum Hills GRRV) FORM A.xls

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change
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WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

NO TYPE STATUS
SEE ATTACHED

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/28/2010
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/28/2010
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/24/2010
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Requested
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 8/16/2010 BIA not yet
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 8/16/2010
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 6/29/2010
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/30/2010
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/30/2010
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
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2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965010693
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QEP Energy (Gypsum Hills GRRV) FORM A.xls

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change
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LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a
COMMENTS:

QEP Energy (Gypsum Hills GRRV) FORM A.xls



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL,GAS AND MINING S. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER
See attached

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEÖR TRIBENAME:SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS See attached
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° See attacheddrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for such proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL O OTHER 8 WEeLLNAM nd NUMBER:

2 NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:Questar Exploration and Production Company $Û $ Attached
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:
1050 17th Street, Suite 500 Denver s,,,, CO z;, 80265 (303) 672-6900 See attached

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: See attached COUNTY: Attached

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE.MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICEOF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

6/14/2010 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE
O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL(Submit Original Fonn Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUT-ÒFFDate of work completion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: Operator Name
O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENTFORMATION Change

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS. Cleady show all pertinent details including dates,depths, volumes, etc.

Effective June 14, 2010 Questar Exploration and Production Company changed its name to QEP Energy Company. This namechange involves only an internal corporate name change and no thirdparty change of operator is involved. The same
employees willcontinue to be responsible for operations of the properties described on the attached list. AIIoperations willcontinue to be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLMReference No. ESBOOOO24)
Utah State Bond Number: 965666683
Fee Land Bond Number:
BIA Bond Number: 799446- O/O{p f3
The attached document is an all inclusive list of the wells operated by Questar Exploration and Production Company. As of
June 14, 2010 QEP Energy Company assumes all rights, duties and obligations as operator of the properties as described onthe list

NAME(PLEASE P NT) Morgan Anderson
TITLE Regulatory AffairsAnalyst

SIGNATURS DATE 6/23/2010

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED APPROVED /g/ Mô9
JUN2 8 2010

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
ÛÎVÎSÎOn of Oil,OasandMiningDIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING EarleneRussell,Engineering
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2 NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:Questar Exploration and Production Company $Û $ Attached
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:
1050 17th Street, Suite 500 Denver s,,,, CO z;, 80265 (303) 672-6900 See attached

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: See attached COUNTY: Attached

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE.MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICEOF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

6/14/2010 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE
O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL(Submit Original Fonn Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUT-ÒFFDate of work completion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: Operator Name
O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENTFORMATION Change

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS. Cleady show all pertinent details including dates,depths, volumes, etc.

Effective June 14, 2010 Questar Exploration and Production Company changed its name to QEP Energy Company. This namechange involves only an internal corporate name change and no thirdparty change of operator is involved. The same
employees willcontinue to be responsible for operations of the properties described on the attached list. AIIoperations willcontinue to be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLMReference No. ESBOOOO24)
Utah State Bond Number: 965666683
Fee Land Bond Number:
BIA Bond Number: 799446- O/O{p f3
The attached document is an all inclusive list of the wells operated by Questar Exploration and Production Company. As of
June 14, 2010 QEP Energy Company assumes all rights, duties and obligations as operator of the properties as described onthe list

NAME(PLEASE P NT) Morgan Anderson
TITLE Regulatory AffairsAnalyst

SIGNATURS DATE 6/23/2010

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED APPROVED /g/ Mô9
JUN2 8 2010

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
ÛÎVÎSÎOn of Oil,OasandMiningDIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING EarleneRussell,Engineering
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Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
GYPSUMHILLS (GRRV)

effectiveJune 14,2010

well_name see twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
leaseGH 4 19 080S 210E 4304730028 5355 Federal OW PG'JI1-19 19 080S 210E 4304731065 5355 Federed ONV P(1823-21 21 080S 210E 4304731541 5355 Federal ()?V PGH 4-21 21 080S 210E 4304731826 5355 Federal OW PGH 5-21 21 080S 210E 4304731827 5355 Federal OW PGH 9 20 080S 210E 4304732304 5355 Federal OW DRL CGH 11 20 080S 210E 4304732459 5355 Federal OW PGH 13 21 080S 210E 4304732460 5355 Federal OW PGH 14 20 080S 210E 4304732647 5355 Federal OW P601 18 20 080S 210E 4304732650 5355 Federal ()VV PGH 19 20 080S 210E 4304732651 5355 Federal OW PGH 20 20 080S 210E 4304732652 5355 Federal OW PGH 16 20 080S 210E 4304732675 5355 Federal OW PGH 10W-19-8-21 19 080S 210E 4304733528 12736 Federal GW P601 10Gr-19-8-21 19 080S 210E 4304733566 5355 Federed CAV PWV 11W-17-8-21 17 080S _210E 4304733912 13228 Federal GW PTV3759V-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304733954 13332 Federal (39V PTV3779V-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304733956 13330 Federal GVV PGE[9NV-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304734150 13392 Federal (19V PGH 16W-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304734156 13354 Federal GW PTV\lK10TV-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304734561 13744 Federal GNV PCURJ(159V-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304734562 13674 Federal (19V PGHX 13HG-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304734723 5355 Federal OW P

GH 1G-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304734927 5355 Federal OW PAN'l>E2\V-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304734928 14253 Federal (ITV PWVX 8W-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304"l34929 13792 Federal GW PCdš4hfD-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304735068 14213 Federal (ITV P
GH 13MU-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304735070 14817 Federal GW PIGH5tv-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304735097 14557 Federal (IRT PWVX 3MU-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304735318 14113 Federal GW P(IH 15híL-18-8-21 18 080S 210E 4304735323 15483 Iù>deral (INV PGli lhdL-19-8-21 19 080S 210E 4304735324 14824 Federed (IMF PWVX 14MU 17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304735369 14098 Federal GW PTV37)C1210RJ-17-8-21 17 080S 2101E 4304735370 15108 Federal CITV PWVX 8MU-19-8-21 19 080S 210E 4304735372 14241 Federal GW PGH 10ML-18-8-21 18 080S 210E 4304735391 15482 Federal GW PGH 8G-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304737992 5355 Federal OW PGlã16G-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304737993 5355 Feder<d O3V PGH 8G-18-8-21 18 080S 210E 4304738661 Federal GW APD CGH 6-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304738662 17041 Federal (GW P

Bonds:BLhn = ESBOOOO24
BIA=956010693

State = 965010695 1 of
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United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
*pCH se Utah State Office og ERICA

P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

http://www.blm.gov/ut/st/en.html

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3100
(UT-922)

JUL 2 8 2010

Memorandum

Fr m:

l FieldhOffice PriaceFie ce Mo Fi

Subject: Name Change Recognized

Attached is a copy of the Certificate of Name Change issued by the Texas Secretary of State and
a decision letter recognizing the name change from the Fastern States Office. We have updated
our records to reflect the name change in the attached list of leases.

The name change from QuestarExploration and Production Company into QEP Energy
Company is effective June 8, 2010.

cc: MMS

United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
*pCH se Utah State Office og ERICA

P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
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RECEIVED: Apr. 01, 2014

                           FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-68219 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 UTE 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 GYPSUM HILLS (GRRV) 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 WV 5W-17-8-21 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047339540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 GYPSUM HILLS 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2151 FNL 0708 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWNW Section: 17 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

4 /1 /2014

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 QEP ENERGY COMPANY PROPOSES TO RECOMPLETE THIS WELL FROM
THE WASATCH FORMATION TO THE GREEN RIVER FORMATION AS

FOLLOWS: 1. SET CIBP AT 7330' AND CAP WITH 50' CLASS "G" OR "B"
CEMENT AND COMPLETE THE WELL IN THE FOLLOWING MANNER: 2.

STAGE 1: 6017' - 6064', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT, FRACTURED WITH GELLED
WATER. 3. STAGE 2: 5453' - 5846', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT, FRACTURED
WITH GELLED WATER. 4. STAGE 3: 5063' - 5180', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT,

FRACTURED WITH GELLED WATER. 5. STAGE 4: 4425' - 4820', 3 SHOTS
PER FOOT, FRACTURED WITH GELLED WATER. 6. RUN PRODUCTION

EQUIPMENT AND PWOP. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Benna Muth 435 781-4320

TITLE
 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 4 /1 /2014

April 07, 2014

Sundry Number: 49391 API Well Number: 43047339540000Sundry Number: 49391 API Well Number: 43047339540000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-68219

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 F INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. GYPSUM HILLS(GRRV)

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well WV 5W-17-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047339540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext GYPSUM HILLS

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

2151 FNL 0708 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWNW Section: 17 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

4/1/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP ENERGYCOMPANYPROPOSES TO RECOMPLETETHIS WELLFROM Accepted by the
THE WASATCH FORMATIONTO THE GREEN RIVER FORMATIONAS Utah Division of

FOLLOWS: 1. SET CIBP AT 7330' AND CAP WITH 50' CLASS "G" OR "B" Oil, Gas and Mining

CEMENT AND COMPLETE THE WELL INTHE FOLLOWING MANNER:2. Date: April 07, 2014
STAGE 1: 6017' - 6064', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT, FRACTURED WITH GELLED

WATER. 3. STAGE 2: 5453' - 5846', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT, FRACTURED sy: \ As/\È
WITH GELLED WATER. 4. STAGE 3: 5063' - 5180', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT,

FRACTURED WITH GELLED WATER. 5. STAGE 4: 4425' - 4820', 3 SHOTS
PER FOOT, FRACTURED WITH GELLED WATER. 6. RUN PRODUCTION

EQUIPMENT AND PWOP.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Benna Muth 435 781-4320 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 4/1/2014

RECEIVED: Apr. 01,

Sundry Number: 49391 API Well Number: 43047339540000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-68219

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 F INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. GYPSUM HILLS(GRRV)

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well WV 5W-17-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047339540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext GYPSUM HILLS

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

2151 FNL 0708 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWNW Section: 17 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

4/1/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP ENERGYCOMPANYPROPOSES TO RECOMPLETETHIS WELLFROM Accepted by the
THE WASATCH FORMATIONTO THE GREEN RIVER FORMATIONAS Utah Division of

FOLLOWS: 1. SET CIBP AT 7330' AND CAP WITH 50' CLASS "G" OR "B" Oil, Gas and Mining

CEMENT AND COMPLETE THE WELL INTHE FOLLOWING MANNER:2. Date: April 07, 2014
STAGE 1: 6017' - 6064', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT, FRACTURED WITH GELLED

WATER. 3. STAGE 2: 5453' - 5846', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT, FRACTURED sy: \ As/\È
WITH GELLED WATER. 4. STAGE 3: 5063' - 5180', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT,

FRACTURED WITH GELLED WATER. 5. STAGE 4: 4425' - 4820', 3 SHOTS
PER FOOT, FRACTURED WITH GELLED WATER. 6. RUN PRODUCTION

EQUIPMENT AND PWOP.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Benna Muth 435 781-4320 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 4/1/2014

RECEIVED: Apr. 01,

Sundry Number: 49391 API Well Number: 43047339540000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-68219

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 F INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. GYPSUM HILLS(GRRV)

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well WV 5W-17-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047339540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext GYPSUM HILLS

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

2151 FNL 0708 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWNW Section: 17 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

4/1/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP ENERGYCOMPANYPROPOSES TO RECOMPLETETHIS WELLFROM Accepted by the
THE WASATCH FORMATIONTO THE GREEN RIVER FORMATIONAS Utah Division of

FOLLOWS: 1. SET CIBP AT 7330' AND CAP WITH 50' CLASS "G" OR "B" Oil, Gas and Mining

CEMENT AND COMPLETE THE WELL INTHE FOLLOWING MANNER:2. Date: April 07, 2014
STAGE 1: 6017' - 6064', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT, FRACTURED WITH GELLED

WATER. 3. STAGE 2: 5453' - 5846', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT, FRACTURED sy: \ As/\È
WITH GELLED WATER. 4. STAGE 3: 5063' - 5180', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT,

FRACTURED WITH GELLED WATER. 5. STAGE 4: 4425' - 4820', 3 SHOTS
PER FOOT, FRACTURED WITH GELLED WATER. 6. RUN PRODUCTION

EQUIPMENT AND PWOP.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Benna Muth 435 781-4320 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 4/1/2014

RECEIVED: Apr. 01,

Sundry Number: 49391 API Well Number: 43047339540000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-68219

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 F INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. GYPSUM HILLS(GRRV)

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well WV 5W-17-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047339540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext GYPSUM HILLS

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

2151 FNL 0708 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWNW Section: 17 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

4/1/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP ENERGYCOMPANYPROPOSES TO RECOMPLETETHIS WELLFROM Accepted by the
THE WASATCH FORMATIONTO THE GREEN RIVER FORMATIONAS Utah Division of

FOLLOWS: 1. SET CIBP AT 7330' AND CAP WITH 50' CLASS "G" OR "B" Oil, Gas and Mining

CEMENT AND COMPLETE THE WELL INTHE FOLLOWING MANNER:2. Date: April 07, 2014
STAGE 1: 6017' - 6064', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT, FRACTURED WITH GELLED

WATER. 3. STAGE 2: 5453' - 5846', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT, FRACTURED sy: \ As/\È
WITH GELLED WATER. 4. STAGE 3: 5063' - 5180', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT,

FRACTURED WITH GELLED WATER. 5. STAGE 4: 4425' - 4820', 3 SHOTS
PER FOOT, FRACTURED WITH GELLED WATER. 6. RUN PRODUCTION

EQUIPMENT AND PWOP.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Benna Muth 435 781-4320 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 4/1/2014

RECEIVED: Apr. 01,



RECEIVED: Apr. 07, 2014

  

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43047339540000

100' shall be set on CIBP at 7330' as required by R649-3-24-3.2. 

Sundry Number: 49391 API Well Number: 43047339540000Sundry Number: 49391 API Well Number: 43047339540000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources
Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

OTI. GAS N1NTNG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43047339540000

100' shall be set on CIBP at 7330' as required by R649-3-24-3.2.

RECEIVED: Apr. 07,

Sundry Number: 49391 API Well Number: 43047339540000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices
OTI. GAS N1NTNG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43047339540000

100' shall be set on CIBP at 7330' as required by R649-3-24-3.2.

RECEIVED: Apr. 07,

Sundry Number: 49391 API Well Number: 43047339540000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices
OTI. GAS N1NTNG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43047339540000

100' shall be set on CIBP at 7330' as required by R649-3-24-3.2.

RECEIVED: Apr. 07,

Sundry Number: 49391 API Well Number: 43047339540000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices
OTI. GAS N1NTNG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43047339540000

100' shall be set on CIBP at 7330' as required by R649-3-24-3.2.

RECEIVED: Apr. 07,



RECEIVED: May. 12, 2014

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-68219 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 UTE 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 GYPSUM HILLS (GRRV) 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 WV 5W-17-8-21 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047339540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 GYPSUM HILLS 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2151 FNL 0708 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWNW Section: 17 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

5 /8 /2014

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 THIS SUNDRY IS BEING SUBMITTED CONFIRMING WORK WAS
COMPLETED AS OUTLINED IN THE NOTICE OF INTENT SUBMITTED ON

4/1/2014 TO RECOMPLETE TO THE GREEN RIVER FORMATION. DETAILS
WILL FOLLOW IN FORM 8- WELL COMPLETION REPORT. THIS WELL WAS
TURNED TO PRODUCTION 5/8/2014 AT 2:30 PM. PLEASE CHANGE THIS

WELL TYPE FROM GAS TO OIL.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Valyn Davis 435 781-4369

TITLE
 Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 5 /12 /2014

May 13, 2014

Sundry Number: 51064 API Well Number: 43047339540000Sundry Number: 51064 API Well Number: 43047339540000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-68219

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 F INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. GYPSUM HILLS(GRRV)

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well WV 5W-17-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047339540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext GYPSUM HILLS

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

2151 FNL 0708 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWNW Section: 17 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

5/8/20 14
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

THIS SUNDRY IS BEING SUBMITTEDCONFIRMINGWORK WAS Accepted by the
COMPLETED AS OUTLINED INTHE NOTICE OF INTENT SUBMITTED ON Utah Division of

4/1/2014 TO RECOMPLETE TO THE GREEN RIVER FORMATION. DETAILS Oil, Gas and Mining

WILLFOLLOW IN FORM 8- WELL COMPLETION REPORT. THIS WELLWAS FOBagÇORP ONLY
TURNED TO PRODUCTION 5/8/2014 AT 2:30 PM. PLEASE CHANGE THIS

WELLTYPE FROM GAS TO OIL.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Valyn Davis 435 781-4369 Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/12/2014

RECEIVED: May. 12,

Sundry Number: 51064 API Well Number: 43047339540000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-68219

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 F INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. GYPSUM HILLS(GRRV)

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well WV 5W-17-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047339540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext GYPSUM HILLS

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

2151 FNL 0708 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWNW Section: 17 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

5/8/20 14
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

THIS SUNDRY IS BEING SUBMITTEDCONFIRMINGWORK WAS Accepted by the
COMPLETED AS OUTLINED INTHE NOTICE OF INTENT SUBMITTED ON Utah Division of

4/1/2014 TO RECOMPLETE TO THE GREEN RIVER FORMATION. DETAILS Oil, Gas and Mining

WILLFOLLOW IN FORM 8- WELL COMPLETION REPORT. THIS WELLWAS FOBagÇORP ONLY
TURNED TO PRODUCTION 5/8/2014 AT 2:30 PM. PLEASE CHANGE THIS

WELLTYPE FROM GAS TO OIL.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Valyn Davis 435 781-4369 Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/12/2014

RECEIVED: May. 12,

Sundry Number: 51064 API Well Number: 43047339540000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-68219

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 F INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. GYPSUM HILLS(GRRV)

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well WV 5W-17-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047339540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext GYPSUM HILLS

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

2151 FNL 0708 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWNW Section: 17 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

5/8/20 14
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

THIS SUNDRY IS BEING SUBMITTEDCONFIRMINGWORK WAS Accepted by the
COMPLETED AS OUTLINED INTHE NOTICE OF INTENT SUBMITTED ON Utah Division of

4/1/2014 TO RECOMPLETE TO THE GREEN RIVER FORMATION. DETAILS Oil, Gas and Mining

WILLFOLLOW IN FORM 8- WELL COMPLETION REPORT. THIS WELLWAS FOBagÇORP ONLY
TURNED TO PRODUCTION 5/8/2014 AT 2:30 PM. PLEASE CHANGE THIS

WELLTYPE FROM GAS TO OIL.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Valyn Davis 435 781-4369 Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/12/2014

RECEIVED: May. 12,

Sundry Number: 51064 API Well Number: 43047339540000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-68219

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 F INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. GYPSUM HILLS(GRRV)

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well WV 5W-17-8-21

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047339540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext GYPSUM HILLS

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

2151 FNL 0708 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWNW Section: 17 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

5/8/20 14
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

THIS SUNDRY IS BEING SUBMITTEDCONFIRMINGWORK WAS Accepted by the
COMPLETED AS OUTLINED INTHE NOTICE OF INTENT SUBMITTED ON Utah Division of

4/1/2014 TO RECOMPLETE TO THE GREEN RIVER FORMATION. DETAILS Oil, Gas and Mining

WILLFOLLOW IN FORM 8- WELL COMPLETION REPORT. THIS WELLWAS FOBagÇORP ONLY
TURNED TO PRODUCTION 5/8/2014 AT 2:30 PM. PLEASE CHANGE THIS

WELLTYPE FROM GAS TO OIL.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Valyn Davis 435 781-4369 Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/12/2014

RECEIVED: May. 12,



RECEIVED: Jul. 29, 2014

Sundry Number: 53020 API Well Number: 43047339540000Sundry Number: 53020 API Well Number: 43047339540000

STATE OF UTAH AMENDED REPORT FORM 8
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES (highlight changes)

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5, LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTU68219

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
6. IF NDlAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

1a. TYPE OF WELL: OWELLL ESLL DRY OTHER 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF WORK: S. WELLNAME and NUMBER:
NEEWL HLAOR EP-

RY
EFSFŸR.

OTHER RE-COMPLETE WV 5W-17-8-21
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

QEP ENERGY COMPANY 4304733954
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

1100S E. 17500 S. CITY VERNAL STATE UT ZIP84078 (435) 781-4320 GYPSUM HILLS
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

MERIDIAN:
AT SURFACE: SWNW, 2,151' FNL, 708' FWL

SWNW 17 8S 21E
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVAL REPORTED BELOW: SWNW, 2,151' FNL, 708' FWL

12. COUNTY 13. STATE
AT TOTALDEPTH: SWNW, 2,151' FNL, 708' FWL UINTAH UTAN

14. DATESPUDDEO: 15. DATET.D. REACHED: 16. DATE COMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL):

10/3/2001 5/8/2014 ABANDONED READYTO PRODUCE

18. TOTAL DEPTH: MD 19. PLUG BACK T.D.: MD 20. IF MULTIPLE COMPLETIONS, HOW MANY?* 21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD 7,330PLUGSET:
TVD TVD TVD

22. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICAL LOGS RUN (Submit copy of each) 23.

WAS WELLCORED? NO YES (Submit analysis)

WAS DST RUN? NO YES (Submuepod

DIRECTIONALSURVEY? NO YES (Submit copy)

24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in well)

HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE WEf GHT (#lft.) TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD)
STAGE CEMHENTER CEMEONF

S
KE& UMRE

BL) CEMENT TOP ** AMOUNT PULLED

25. TUBING RECORD

DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKERSET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

26. PRODUC1NGINTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD

FORMATIONNAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM (TVD) INTERVAL (Top/Bot - MD) SIZE NO. HOLES PERFORATIONSTATUS

(A) GREEN RIVER 4,425 6,063 4,425 6,063 .42 235 open Squeezed

(B) Open Squeezed

(C) Open Squeezed

(D) Open Squeezed

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT,CEMENTSQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH IbiTERVAL AMOUNTAND TYPE OF MATERLAL

4,425 - 6,603 4,842 BBLS SLICKWATER; 380,320 LBS 20/40 SAND

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

ELECTRICAL/MECHAN1CALLOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONALSURVEY POWO SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGINGANDCEMENTVEREFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER:

(5/2000) (CONTINUED ON BACK)

RECEIVED: Jul. 29,

Sundry Number: 53020 API Well Number: 43047339540000

STATE OF UTAH AMENDED REPORT FORM 8
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES (highlight changes)

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5, LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTU68219

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
6. IF NDlAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

1a. TYPE OF WELL: OWELLL ESLL DRY OTHER 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF WORK: S. WELLNAME and NUMBER:
NEEWL HLAOR EP-

RY
EFSFŸR.

OTHER RE-COMPLETE WV 5W-17-8-21
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

QEP ENERGY COMPANY 4304733954
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

1100S E. 17500 S. CITY VERNAL STATE UT ZIP84078 (435) 781-4320 GYPSUM HILLS
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

MERIDIAN:
AT SURFACE: SWNW, 2,151' FNL, 708' FWL

SWNW 17 8S 21E
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVAL REPORTED BELOW: SWNW, 2,151' FNL, 708' FWL

12. COUNTY 13. STATE
AT TOTALDEPTH: SWNW, 2,151' FNL, 708' FWL UINTAH UTAN

14. DATESPUDDEO: 15. DATET.D. REACHED: 16. DATE COMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL):

10/3/2001 5/8/2014 ABANDONED READYTO PRODUCE

18. TOTAL DEPTH: MD 19. PLUG BACK T.D.: MD 20. IF MULTIPLE COMPLETIONS, HOW MANY?* 21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD 7,330PLUGSET:
TVD TVD TVD

22. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICAL LOGS RUN (Submit copy of each) 23.

WAS WELLCORED? NO YES (Submit analysis)

WAS DST RUN? NO YES (Submuepod

DIRECTIONALSURVEY? NO YES (Submit copy)

24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in well)

HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE WEf GHT (#lft.) TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD)
STAGE CEMHENTER CEMEONF

S
KE& UMRE

BL) CEMENT TOP ** AMOUNT PULLED

25. TUBING RECORD

DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKERSET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

26. PRODUC1NGINTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD

FORMATIONNAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM (TVD) INTERVAL (Top/Bot - MD) SIZE NO. HOLES PERFORATIONSTATUS

(A) GREEN RIVER 4,425 6,063 4,425 6,063 .42 235 open Squeezed

(B) Open Squeezed

(C) Open Squeezed

(D) Open Squeezed

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT,CEMENTSQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH IbiTERVAL AMOUNTAND TYPE OF MATERLAL

4,425 - 6,603 4,842 BBLS SLICKWATER; 380,320 LBS 20/40 SAND

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

ELECTRICAL/MECHAN1CALLOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONALSURVEY POWO SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGINGANDCEMENTVEREFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER:

(5/2000) (CONTINUED ON BACK)

RECEIVED: Jul. 29,

Sundry Number: 53020 API Well Number: 43047339540000

STATE OF UTAH AMENDED REPORT FORM 8
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES (highlight changes)

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5, LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTU68219

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
6. IF NDlAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

1a. TYPE OF WELL: OWELLL ESLL DRY OTHER 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF WORK: S. WELLNAME and NUMBER:
NEEWL HLAOR EP-

RY
EFSFŸR.

OTHER RE-COMPLETE WV 5W-17-8-21
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

QEP ENERGY COMPANY 4304733954
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

1100S E. 17500 S. CITY VERNAL STATE UT ZIP84078 (435) 781-4320 GYPSUM HILLS
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

MERIDIAN:
AT SURFACE: SWNW, 2,151' FNL, 708' FWL

SWNW 17 8S 21E
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVAL REPORTED BELOW: SWNW, 2,151' FNL, 708' FWL

12. COUNTY 13. STATE
AT TOTALDEPTH: SWNW, 2,151' FNL, 708' FWL UINTAH UTAN

14. DATESPUDDEO: 15. DATET.D. REACHED: 16. DATE COMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL):

10/3/2001 5/8/2014 ABANDONED READYTO PRODUCE

18. TOTAL DEPTH: MD 19. PLUG BACK T.D.: MD 20. IF MULTIPLE COMPLETIONS, HOW MANY?* 21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD 7,330PLUGSET:
TVD TVD TVD

22. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICAL LOGS RUN (Submit copy of each) 23.

WAS WELLCORED? NO YES (Submit analysis)

WAS DST RUN? NO YES (Submuepod

DIRECTIONALSURVEY? NO YES (Submit copy)

24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in well)

HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE WEf GHT (#lft.) TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD)
STAGE CEMHENTER CEMEONF

S
KE& UMRE

BL) CEMENT TOP ** AMOUNT PULLED

25. TUBING RECORD

DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKERSET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

26. PRODUC1NGINTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD

FORMATIONNAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM (TVD) INTERVAL (Top/Bot - MD) SIZE NO. HOLES PERFORATIONSTATUS

(A) GREEN RIVER 4,425 6,063 4,425 6,063 .42 235 open Squeezed

(B) Open Squeezed

(C) Open Squeezed

(D) Open Squeezed

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT,CEMENTSQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH IbiTERVAL AMOUNTAND TYPE OF MATERLAL

4,425 - 6,603 4,842 BBLS SLICKWATER; 380,320 LBS 20/40 SAND

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

ELECTRICAL/MECHAN1CALLOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONALSURVEY POWO SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGINGANDCEMENTVEREFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER:

(5/2000) (CONTINUED ON BACK)

RECEIVED: Jul. 29,

Sundry Number: 53020 API Well Number: 43047339540000

STATE OF UTAH AMENDED REPORT FORM 8
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES (highlight changes)

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5, LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTU68219

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
6. IF NDlAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

1a. TYPE OF WELL: OWELLL ESLL DRY OTHER 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF WORK: S. WELLNAME and NUMBER:
NEEWL HLAOR EP-

RY
EFSFŸR.

OTHER RE-COMPLETE WV 5W-17-8-21
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

QEP ENERGY COMPANY 4304733954
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

1100S E. 17500 S. CITY VERNAL STATE UT ZIP84078 (435) 781-4320 GYPSUM HILLS
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

MERIDIAN:
AT SURFACE: SWNW, 2,151' FNL, 708' FWL

SWNW 17 8S 21E
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVAL REPORTED BELOW: SWNW, 2,151' FNL, 708' FWL

12. COUNTY 13. STATE
AT TOTALDEPTH: SWNW, 2,151' FNL, 708' FWL UINTAH UTAN

14. DATESPUDDEO: 15. DATET.D. REACHED: 16. DATE COMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL):

10/3/2001 5/8/2014 ABANDONED READYTO PRODUCE

18. TOTAL DEPTH: MD 19. PLUG BACK T.D.: MD 20. IF MULTIPLE COMPLETIONS, HOW MANY?* 21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD 7,330PLUGSET:
TVD TVD TVD

22. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICAL LOGS RUN (Submit copy of each) 23.

WAS WELLCORED? NO YES (Submit analysis)

WAS DST RUN? NO YES (Submuepod

DIRECTIONALSURVEY? NO YES (Submit copy)

24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in well)

HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE WEf GHT (#lft.) TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD)
STAGE CEMHENTER CEMEONF

S
KE& UMRE

BL) CEMENT TOP ** AMOUNT PULLED

25. TUBING RECORD

DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKERSET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

26. PRODUC1NGINTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD

FORMATIONNAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM (TVD) INTERVAL (Top/Bot - MD) SIZE NO. HOLES PERFORATIONSTATUS

(A) GREEN RIVER 4,425 6,063 4,425 6,063 .42 235 open Squeezed

(B) Open Squeezed

(C) Open Squeezed

(D) Open Squeezed

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT,CEMENTSQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH IbiTERVAL AMOUNTAND TYPE OF MATERLAL

4,425 - 6,603 4,842 BBLS SLICKWATER; 380,320 LBS 20/40 SAND

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

ELECTRICAL/MECHAN1CALLOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONALSURVEY POWO SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGINGANDCEMENTVEREFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER:

(5/2000) (CONTINUED ON BACK)

RECEIVED: Jul. 29,



RECEIVED: Jul. 29, 2014

Sundry Number: 53020 API Well Number: 43047339540000Sundry Number: 53020 API Well Number: 43047339540000

31 INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVAL A (As shown ln item #26)

OATE FIRST PRODUCED; TEST OATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD METHOD:
5/9/2014 RATES: ->

CHOKESIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES; -*

INTERVAL B (As shown in item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: ->

CHOKE SIZE: TBG- PRESS. CSG, PRESS API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: 1NTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: ->

INTERVALC (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES:

CHDKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTlON OIL- BBL: GAS- MCF WATER- BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES:

INTERVAL D (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: *

CHOKE SlZE: BG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVlTY BTU- GAS GAS/OILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER- BBI INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES:

32. DISPOSITIONOF GAS (Sold, Used for Fue], Vented, Etc.)

33. SUMMARYOFPOROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION (Log) MARKERS:

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Formation Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name
(Meast

eDdpDepth)

35. ADDITIONALREMARK: (Include plugging procedum)

THE WS ZONE WAS PLUGGED AND NEW PERFS ADDED TO THE GR FORMATION. WELL STATUS IS NOW POW.

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correctas determined from all available records.

NAME(PLEASEPRiNT) BENNA MUTH TITLE REGULATORY ASSISTANT - CONTRACT

SIGNATURE DATE 7/29/2014

This report must be submitted within 30 days of
• completing or plugging a new well e reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
e drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore e significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
e recompleting to a different producing formation e drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM 20: Show the numberof completions if production is measured separately from two or more formations.

** ITEM 24: Cement Top - Show how reported top(s) of cement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL), cement bond log (CBL), temperature survey (TS))

Send to: Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(s2000)

RECEIVED: Jul. 29,

Sundry Number: 53020 API Well Number: 43047339540000

31 INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVAL A (As shown ln item #26)

OATE FIRST PRODUCED; TEST OATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD METHOD:
5/9/2014 RATES: ->

CHOKESIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES; -*

INTERVAL B (As shown in item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: ->

CHOKE SIZE: TBG- PRESS. CSG, PRESS API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: 1NTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: ->

INTERVALC (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES:

CHDKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTlON OIL- BBL: GAS- MCF WATER- BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES:

INTERVAL D (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: *

CHOKE SlZE: BG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVlTY BTU- GAS GAS/OILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER- BBI INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES:

32. DISPOSITIONOF GAS (Sold, Used for Fue], Vented, Etc.)

33. SUMMARYOFPOROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION (Log) MARKERS:

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Formation Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name
(Meast

eDdpDepth)

35. ADDITIONALREMARK: (Include plugging procedum)

THE WS ZONE WAS PLUGGED AND NEW PERFS ADDED TO THE GR FORMATION. WELL STATUS IS NOW POW.

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correctas determined from all available records.

NAME(PLEASEPRiNT) BENNA MUTH TITLE REGULATORY ASSISTANT - CONTRACT

SIGNATURE DATE 7/29/2014

This report must be submitted within 30 days of
• completing or plugging a new well e reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
e drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore e significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
e recompleting to a different producing formation e drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM 20: Show the numberof completions if production is measured separately from two or more formations.

** ITEM 24: Cement Top - Show how reported top(s) of cement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL), cement bond log (CBL), temperature survey (TS))

Send to: Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(s2000)

RECEIVED: Jul. 29,

Sundry Number: 53020 API Well Number: 43047339540000

31 INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVAL A (As shown ln item #26)

OATE FIRST PRODUCED; TEST OATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD METHOD:
5/9/2014 RATES: ->

CHOKESIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES; -*

INTERVAL B (As shown in item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: ->

CHOKE SIZE: TBG- PRESS. CSG, PRESS API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: 1NTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: ->

INTERVALC (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES:

CHDKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTlON OIL- BBL: GAS- MCF WATER- BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES:

INTERVAL D (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: *

CHOKE SlZE: BG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVlTY BTU- GAS GAS/OILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER- BBI INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES:

32. DISPOSITIONOF GAS (Sold, Used for Fue], Vented, Etc.)

33. SUMMARYOFPOROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION (Log) MARKERS:

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Formation Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name
(Meast

eDdpDepth)

35. ADDITIONALREMARK: (Include plugging procedum)

THE WS ZONE WAS PLUGGED AND NEW PERFS ADDED TO THE GR FORMATION. WELL STATUS IS NOW POW.

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correctas determined from all available records.

NAME(PLEASEPRiNT) BENNA MUTH TITLE REGULATORY ASSISTANT - CONTRACT

SIGNATURE DATE 7/29/2014

This report must be submitted within 30 days of
• completing or plugging a new well e reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
e drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore e significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
e recompleting to a different producing formation e drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM 20: Show the numberof completions if production is measured separately from two or more formations.

** ITEM 24: Cement Top - Show how reported top(s) of cement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL), cement bond log (CBL), temperature survey (TS))

Send to: Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(s2000)

RECEIVED: Jul. 29,

Sundry Number: 53020 API Well Number: 43047339540000

31 INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVAL A (As shown ln item #26)

OATE FIRST PRODUCED; TEST OATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD METHOD:
5/9/2014 RATES: ->

CHOKESIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES; -*

INTERVAL B (As shown in item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: ->

CHOKE SIZE: TBG- PRESS. CSG, PRESS API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: 1NTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: ->

INTERVALC (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES:

CHDKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTlON OIL- BBL: GAS- MCF WATER- BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES:

INTERVAL D (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: *

CHOKE SlZE: BG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVlTY BTU- GAS GAS/OILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER- BBI INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES:

32. DISPOSITIONOF GAS (Sold, Used for Fue], Vented, Etc.)

33. SUMMARYOFPOROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION (Log) MARKERS:

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Formation Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name
(Meast

eDdpDepth)

35. ADDITIONALREMARK: (Include plugging procedum)

THE WS ZONE WAS PLUGGED AND NEW PERFS ADDED TO THE GR FORMATION. WELL STATUS IS NOW POW.

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correctas determined from all available records.

NAME(PLEASEPRiNT) BENNA MUTH TITLE REGULATORY ASSISTANT - CONTRACT

SIGNATURE DATE 7/29/2014

This report must be submitted within 30 days of
• completing or plugging a new well e reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
e drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore e significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
e recompleting to a different producing formation e drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM 20: Show the numberof completions if production is measured separately from two or more formations.

** ITEM 24: Cement Top - Show how reported top(s) of cement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL), cement bond log (CBL), temperature survey (TS))

Send to: Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(s2000)

RECEIVED: Jul. 29,



STATE OF UTAH 
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 

ENTITY ACTION FORM 

FORMe 

Operator: QEP ENERGY COMPANY Operator Account Number: ...:..N,,--3_7_00 __ _ 

Address: 11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH 

city VERNAL 

state UT zip 84078 Phone Number: (435) 781-4320 

Well 1 

API Nurnber Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County 

4304733954 WV 5W-17-8-21 SWNW 17 8S 21E UINTAH 

Action Code Current Entity New~ntity Spud Date Entity Assignment 
Number Number Effective Date 

D 13332 9999 10/3/2001 51912014 

Comments: 
WSTOGR \A.)51 c... \2:83 ~ 

G.~P-'J -5~S 9:/14 ( I L.j 

Well 2 

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng . County 

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date EntitY Assigt,~ent 
Number Number Effective Date 

Comments: 

Well 3 

API Number Well Name QQ Sec TWp Rng County 

ActlonCode Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity AsSignment 
Number Number Effective Date 

Comments: 

ACTION CODES: 
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) BENNAMUTH 

B - Add new well to existing entity (group or unit well) 
C • Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity 

Signature D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a newieQ~~EIVED 
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) REGULATORY ASSISTANT 7/1/2014 

1"1 :': 2014 Title Date 

(512000) 

. »~.:, GJS & Mi!"dng 

STATE OF UTAH FORM6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator: QEP ENERGYCOMPANY Operator Account Number: N 3700

Address: 11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH

city VERNAL

ptate UT zip 84078 Phone Number: (435) 781-4320

Well 1

API Nuniber WeÑName QQ Sec Twp Rng Coûnty
4304733954 WV 5W-17-8-21 SWNW 17 8S 21E UINTAH

Action Code Current Entity ow Entity Spud Date Entity Assignrnent
Number Nurnber Effective Date

D 13332 9999 10/3/2001 5/9/2014

Comments:
WS TO GR

L

weil&f
Number Well Nan e QQ Sec Túp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity Neor Entity Spud Date EntitiAssignment
Ñuinber Number Effâctivé ÖÑe

Comments:

weilAPI
Number Well Narne QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

ACTION CODES:
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) BENNA MUTH

B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unitwell) Na e (P se Print)
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity 7¾

D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a newuäCEIVED si...a r.
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) REGULATORY ASSISTANT 7/1/2014

(5/2000}

Gas&

STATE OF UTAH FORM6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator: QEP ENERGYCOMPANY Operator Account Number: N 3700

Address: 11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH

city VERNAL

ptate UT zip 84078 Phone Number: (435) 781-4320

Well 1

API Nuniber WeÑName QQ Sec Twp Rng Coûnty
4304733954 WV 5W-17-8-21 SWNW 17 8S 21E UINTAH

Action Code Current Entity ow Entity Spud Date Entity Assignrnent
Number Nurnber Effective Date

D 13332 9999 10/3/2001 5/9/2014

Comments:
WS TO GR

L

weil&f
Number Well Nan e QQ Sec Túp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity Neor Entity Spud Date EntitiAssignment
Ñuinber Number Effâctivé ÖÑe

Comments:

weilAPI
Number Well Narne QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

ACTION CODES:
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) BENNA MUTH

B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unitwell) Na e (P se Print)
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity 7¾

D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a newuäCEIVED si...a r.
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) REGULATORY ASSISTANT 7/1/2014

(5/2000}

Gas&

STATE OF UTAH FORM6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator: QEP ENERGYCOMPANY Operator Account Number: N 3700

Address: 11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH

city VERNAL

ptate UT zip 84078 Phone Number: (435) 781-4320

Well 1

API Nuniber WeÑName QQ Sec Twp Rng Coûnty
4304733954 WV 5W-17-8-21 SWNW 17 8S 21E UINTAH

Action Code Current Entity ow Entity Spud Date Entity Assignrnent
Number Nurnber Effective Date

D 13332 9999 10/3/2001 5/9/2014

Comments:
WS TO GR

L

weil&f
Number Well Nan e QQ Sec Túp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity Neor Entity Spud Date EntitiAssignment
Ñuinber Number Effâctivé ÖÑe

Comments:

weilAPI
Number Well Narne QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

ACTION CODES:
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) BENNA MUTH

B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unitwell) Na e (P se Print)
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity 7¾

D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a newuäCEIVED si...a r.
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) REGULATORY ASSISTANT 7/1/2014

(5/2000}

Gas&

STATE OF UTAH FORM6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator: QEP ENERGYCOMPANY Operator Account Number: N 3700

Address: 11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH

city VERNAL

ptate UT zip 84078 Phone Number: (435) 781-4320

Well 1

API Nuniber WeÑName QQ Sec Twp Rng Coûnty
4304733954 WV 5W-17-8-21 SWNW 17 8S 21E UINTAH

Action Code Current Entity ow Entity Spud Date Entity Assignrnent
Number Nurnber Effective Date

D 13332 9999 10/3/2001 5/9/2014

Comments:
WS TO GR

L

weil&f
Number Well Nan e QQ Sec Túp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity Neor Entity Spud Date EntitiAssignment
Ñuinber Number Effâctivé ÖÑe

Comments:

weilAPI
Number Well Narne QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

ACTION CODES:
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) BENNA MUTH

B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unitwell) Na e (P se Print)
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity 7¾

D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a newuäCEIVED si...a r.
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) REGULATORY ASSISTANT 7/1/2014

(5/2000}

Gas&



RECEIVED: Oct. 27, 2014

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

STATE OF UTAH AMENDED REPORT $s FORM8
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES (highlightchanges)

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNAT]ONANDSERIALNUMBER;

UTU68219

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
8. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

18. TYPE OF WELL; OWELLL ESLL DRY OTHER 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENTNAME

b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
EL

HOR EP-
RY S . OTHER RE-COMPLETE WV 5W-17-8-21

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR
, API NUMBER:

QEP ENERGY COMPANY 4304733954
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR PHONENUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
1100S E. 17500 S. cav VERNAL STATE UT ZIP84078 (435) 781-4320 GYPSUM HILLS

4. LOCATIONOFWELL(FOOTAGES) 11. OTWOTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,
MERIDIAN:AT SURFACE: SWNW, 2,151' FNL, 708' FWL

SWNW 17 8S 21E
AT TOPPRODUC1NG[NTERVAL REPORTED BELOW: SWNW, 2,151' FNL, 708' FWL

12. COUNTY 13. STATEAT TOTALDEPTH; SWNW, 2,151' FNL, 708' FWL UINTAH UTAH
14. DATE SPUDDED: 15, DATE T.D. REACNED: 16. DATE COMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL):

10/3/2001 5/8/2014 ABANDONED READYTO PRODUCE

18. TOTAI. DEPTH: MD 10. PLUGBACKT.D.: MD 20. ]F MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS.HOWMANY?* 21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD 7,330FLUG SET
TVD TVD TVD

22. TYPE ELEGTR1C AND OTHER MECHANICAL LOGS RUN (Submit copy of each) 23.

WAS WELL CORED? NO YES (Submit aantymis)
WAS DST RUN7 NO YES (SubmRæp N
DIRECTIONAL SURVEY? NO YES (Subon c

24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report aÏfstrings set in Wei)

HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE WElGHT(#RL) TOP (MD} BOTTOM(MO) STAGE CEMHEIVTER CN EO
S

CKES
VD UME BL) CEMENTTOP ** AMOIJNT PULLED

25. TUBINGRECORD

DEPTUSET(MD) PACKERSET(MD) SIZE DEPTNSET(MO) PACKERSET(MD) SJZE DEFTHSET(MD) PACKERSET(MD)

26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATIONRECDRD

FORMATIONNAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD} TOP (TVD) BOTTDM(TVD) INTERVAL(ToplBot - MD) SIZE ND. HOLES PERFORATFON STATUS

(^) GREEN RIVER 4,425 6,063 4,425 6,063 .42 235 ovan O Squee2ed

(B) Open Squeezed

(C) Open Sqwd

(D) Open Squeezed

28. ACID,FRACTURE,TREATMENT,CEMENTSQUEEZE, ETC,

DEFTHINTERVAL AMOUNTAND TYPEOF MATERlAL

4,425 - 6,603 4,842 BBLS SLICKWATER; 380,320 LBS 20/40 SAND

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS• 30. WELL STATUS:

ELECTRICAUMECHANICAL LOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONAL SURVEY POWO SUNDRYNOT1CE FOR PLUGGINGAND CEMENT VERfFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER

(5/2000) (CONTINUED ON BACK)

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

STATE OF UTAH AMENDED REPORT $s FORM8
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES (highlightchanges)

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNAT]ONANDSERIALNUMBER;

UTU68219

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
8. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

18. TYPE OF WELL; OWELLL ESLL DRY OTHER 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENTNAME

b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
EL

HOR EP-
RY S . OTHER RE-COMPLETE WV 5W-17-8-21

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR
, API NUMBER:

QEP ENERGY COMPANY 4304733954
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR PHONENUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
1100S E. 17500 S. cav VERNAL STATE UT ZIP84078 (435) 781-4320 GYPSUM HILLS

4. LOCATIONOFWELL(FOOTAGES) 11. OTWOTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,
MERIDIAN:AT SURFACE: SWNW, 2,151' FNL, 708' FWL

SWNW 17 8S 21E
AT TOPPRODUC1NG[NTERVAL REPORTED BELOW: SWNW, 2,151' FNL, 708' FWL

12. COUNTY 13. STATEAT TOTALDEPTH; SWNW, 2,151' FNL, 708' FWL UINTAH UTAH
14. DATE SPUDDED: 15, DATE T.D. REACNED: 16. DATE COMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL):

10/3/2001 5/8/2014 ABANDONED READYTO PRODUCE

18. TOTAI. DEPTH: MD 10. PLUGBACKT.D.: MD 20. ]F MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS.HOWMANY?* 21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD 7,330FLUG SET
TVD TVD TVD

22. TYPE ELEGTR1C AND OTHER MECHANICAL LOGS RUN (Submit copy of each) 23.

WAS WELL CORED? NO YES (Submit aantymis)
WAS DST RUN7 NO YES (SubmRæp N
DIRECTIONAL SURVEY? NO YES (Subon c

24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report aÏfstrings set in Wei)

HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE WElGHT(#RL) TOP (MD} BOTTOM(MO) STAGE CEMHEIVTER CN EO
S

CKES
VD UME BL) CEMENTTOP ** AMOIJNT PULLED

25. TUBINGRECORD

DEPTUSET(MD) PACKERSET(MD) SIZE DEPTNSET(MO) PACKERSET(MD) SJZE DEFTHSET(MD) PACKERSET(MD)

26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATIONRECDRD

FORMATIONNAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD} TOP (TVD) BOTTDM(TVD) INTERVAL(ToplBot - MD) SIZE ND. HOLES PERFORATFON STATUS

(^) GREEN RIVER 4,425 6,063 4,425 6,063 .42 235 ovan O Squee2ed

(B) Open Squeezed

(C) Open Sqwd

(D) Open Squeezed

28. ACID,FRACTURE,TREATMENT,CEMENTSQUEEZE, ETC,

DEFTHINTERVAL AMOUNTAND TYPEOF MATERlAL

4,425 - 6,603 4,842 BBLS SLICKWATER; 380,320 LBS 20/40 SAND

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS• 30. WELL STATUS:

ELECTRICAUMECHANICAL LOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONAL SURVEY POWO SUNDRYNOT1CE FOR PLUGGINGAND CEMENT VERfFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER

(5/2000) (CONTINUED ON BACK)

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

STATE OF UTAH AMENDEDREPORT FORM8
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES (highlight changes)

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNAT]ONANDSERIALNUMBER;

UTU68219

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
8. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

18. TYPE OF WELL; OWELLL ESLL DRY OTHER 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENTNAME

b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
EL

HOR EP-
RY S . OTHER RE-COMPLETE WV 5W-17-8-21

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR
, API NUMBER:

QEP ENERGY COMPANY 4304733954
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR PHONENUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
1100S E. 17500 S. cav VERNAL STATE UT ZIP84078 (435) 781-4320 GYPSUM HILLS

4. LOCATIONOFWELL(FOOTAGES) 11. OTWOTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,
MERIDIAN:AT SURFACE: SWNW, 2,151' FNL, 708' FWL

SWNW 17 8S 21E
AT TOPPRODUC1NG[NTERVAL REPORTED BELOW: SWNW, 2,151' FNL, 708' FWL

12. COUNTY 13. STATEAT TOTALDEPTH; SWNW, 2,151' FNL, 708' FWL UINTAH UTAH
14. DATE SPUDDED: 15, DATE T.D. REACNED: 16. DATE COMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL):

10/3/2001 5/8/2014 ABANDONED READYTO PRODUCE

18. TOTAI. DEPTH: MD 10. PLUGBACKT.D.: MD 20. ]F MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS.HOWMANY?* 21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD 7,330FLUG SET
TVD TVD TVD

22. TYPE ELEGTR1C AND OTHER MECHANICAL LOGS RUN (Submit copy of each) 23.

WAS WELL CORED? NO YES (Submit aantymis)
WAS DST RUN7 NO YES (SubmRæp N
DIRECTIONAL SURVEY? NO YES (Subon c

24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report aÏfstrings set in Wei)

HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE WElGHT(#RL) TOP (MD} BOTTOM(MO) STAGE CEMHEIVTER CN EO
S

CKES
VD UME BL) CEMENTTOP ** AMOIJNT PULLED

25. TUBINGRECORD

DEPTUSET(MD) PACKERSET(MD) SIZE DEPTNSET(MO) PACKERSET(MD) SJZE DEFTHSET(MD) PACKERSET(MD)

26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATIONRECDRD

FORMATIONNAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD} TOP (TVD) BOTTDM(TVD) INTERVAL(ToplBot - MD) SIZE ND. HOLES PERFORATFON STATUS

(^) GREEN RIVER 4,425 6,063 4,425 6,063 .42 235 ovan O Squee2ed

(B) Open Squeezed

(C) Open Sqwd

(D) Open Squeezed

28. ACID,FRACTURE,TREATMENT,CEMENTSQUEEZE, ETC,

DEFTHINTERVAL AMOUNTAND TYPEOF MATERlAL

4,425 - 6,603 4,842 BBLS SLICKWATER; 380,320 LBS 20/40 SAND

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS• 30. WELL STATUS:

ELECTRICAUMECHANICAL LOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONAL SURVEY POWO SUNDRYNOT1CE FOR PLUGGINGAND CEMENT VERfFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER

(5/2000) (CONTINUED ON BACK)

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

donstaley
Highlight



RECEIVED: Oct. 27, 2014

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

31. INITIAL PRODUCTION INTERVALA (As shown in item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL GAS- MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
5/9/2014 RATES: ->

CHOKESIZE TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAViTY BTU -GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OiL- BBL GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: ->

INTERVAL B (As shown In item #2(i)
OATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE HOURSTESTED: TEST PRODUCTION DIL - BBL GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL PROD. METHOD:

RATES:

CHOKESIZE TBG.PRESS, CSG.PRESS. APIGRAVlfY BT1J-GAS GAS/OILRATlO Ž4HRPRODUCTION OIL-BBD GAS-MGF: WATER-BBL NTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

INTERVALC (As shown in item #26)
DATEFIRSTPRODUCED: TESTDATE HOURSTESTED: TESTPRODUCT10N OIL-BBL GAS-MCF: WATER-BBL PROD.METHOD:

RATES: -+

CHOKESIZE G.PRESS. CSG.PRESS. PlGRAVITY BTU-GAS GASIOILRATIO 24HRPRODUCT10N 01L-BBL GAS-MCF; WATER-BBL: IMTERVALSTATUS:
RATES. *

INTERVALD(As shown in item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OlL- BBL GAS- MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: *

CHOKESIZE: TBG.PRESS. CSG,PRESS. PIGRAVifY BTU-GAS GASJOILRATIO 24HRPRODUCTION OTL-BBL: GAS-MCF: WATER-BBI; IMTERVALSTATUS:
RATES:

32. DISPOSITIONOF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

33. SUMMARYOFPOROUS2DNES{IncludeAquders): 34. FORMATION(Log)MARKERST

Show 211impadant zones of porosityand cordents thereof: Cored inleivais md all dril-alem Lests, incteding depth interval
fasted, CLishica used, Uma laat open.flowirigand shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Formatiori Descriptions,Contents etc, Nam (Measu
edpDepth)

35. ADDITIONALREMARK (Include plugg og procedure)

THE WS ZONE WAS PLUGGED AND NEW PERFS ADDED TO THE GR FORMATION. WELL STATUS IS NOW POW.

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached informanon is complete and correctas determined from all available records.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) BENNA MUTH TITLE REGULATORY ASSISTANT - CONTRACT

SIGNATURE DATE 7/29/2014

This report must be submitted within 30 days of
a completingor plugging a new well e reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
e drilling horizontal laterals from an existingwell bore e significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottorn-hole depth
e recompleting to a different producing formation a drilling hydrocarbon exploratoryholes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM 20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from two or more formations.

** ITEM 24: Cement Top - Show how reported top(s)of cementwere determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL), cement bond log(CBL}.te mperature survey (TS})

Send to: Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Ternple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(5/2000)

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

31. INITIAL PRODUCTION INTERVALA (As shown in item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL GAS- MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
5/9/2014 RATES: ->

CHOKESIZE TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAViTY BTU -GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OiL- BBL GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: ->

INTERVAL B (As shown In item #2(i)
OATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE HOURSTESTED: TEST PRODUCTION DIL - BBL GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL PROD. METHOD:

RATES:

CHOKESIZE TBG.PRESS, CSG.PRESS. APIGRAVlfY BT1J-GAS GAS/OILRATlO Ž4HRPRODUCTION OIL-BBD GAS-MGF: WATER-BBL NTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

INTERVALC (As shown in item #26)
DATEFIRSTPRODUCED: TESTDATE HOURSTESTED: TESTPRODUCT10N OIL-BBL GAS-MCF: WATER-BBL PROD.METHOD:

RATES: -+

CHOKESIZE G.PRESS. CSG.PRESS. PlGRAVITY BTU-GAS GASIOILRATIO 24HRPRODUCT10N 01L-BBL GAS-MCF; WATER-BBL: IMTERVALSTATUS:
RATES. *

INTERVALD(As shown in item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OlL- BBL GAS- MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: *
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RATES:

32. DISPOSITIONOF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

33. SUMMARYOFPOROUS2DNES{IncludeAquders): 34. FORMATION(Log)MARKERST

Show 211impadant zones of porosityand cordents thereof: Cored inleivais md all dril-alem Lests, incteding depth interval
fasted, CLishica used, Uma laat open.flowirigand shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Formatiori Descriptions,Contents etc, Nam (Measu
edpDepth)

35. ADDITIONALREMARK (Include plugg og procedure)

THE WS ZONE WAS PLUGGED AND NEW PERFS ADDED TO THE GR FORMATION. WELL STATUS IS NOW POW.

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached informanon is complete and correctas determined from all available records.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) BENNA MUTH TITLE REGULATORY ASSISTANT - CONTRACT

SIGNATURE DATE 7/29/2014

This report must be submitted within 30 days of
a completingor plugging a new well e reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
e drilling horizontal laterals from an existingwell bore e significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottorn-hole depth
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RECEIVED: Oct. 27,



RECEIVED: Oct. 27, 2014

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

4/17/2014 06:00 - 4/18/2014 06:00
OEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV BW-17-8-21 Report#1
API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Contlguretion Type
43-047-33954 S17-TBS-R21E GYPSUM HILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Unique We]I ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KB to CF (ft) Spud Date Final DrIg Rig Release Total Depth (AI])(ft, KB)
UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE - 7,850.0
Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Date
AFE - REC (completion) STIMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RIG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) Daily Field Est Total (Cost) Cum Field Est To Date (Cost)
REC-00085 16,314.65 16,314.65
Operations at Reped Time Remarks

M.l.R.U Set 4 1/2" CIBP @7330'.Dump bail 5 SX of cement on topof CIBP. EST @
Operations SummaEy

4/17/14: Road rig & equipment 22 miles. Spot in & rig up. Check ftp=300, fcp=300, Bleed well down. X-Oto 2 3/8" tubing equip on rig & bop's. N.D well head.
N.U well head. R.U floor. Pooh L.D tubinghanger, 241 joint's of 2 3/8" J-55 tubing, F-Nipple, 1 joint of 2 3/8" J-55 with pump off bit sub. M.I.R.U Lone wolf wire
line. R I H with 3 5/8" gage ring to 7350'. Pooh R.D gage ring. Make up & RJ.H with 4 1/2" CIBP. Set CtBP @7330'.Pooh. R.U rig pump to casing pump 110
bbl's of 2% kclwater. Pressure test casing to 4300 #psi. Good test. Bleed off RJ.H & dump bail 5 ax of cement. Est cement top @7280'.Pooh R.D wire line.
S.WJ.F.N

Daily Readings .

Weather Temperature ( F) Road Condiiion Tubing Pressure (psi) Casing Pressure (psi) Rig Time (hr)
Clear 71.0 Dry 300.0 300.0 15.00
Daily Contacts

Jeb Contact Title Mobile

Tom Jones Supervisor 435 823 5400
Baktär.Powell Tool Pusher 435 828 7848

Time Loo
Start Tima End Time Dur (hr) Activity .. .Code Com

06:00 07:00 1.00 DRIVE TO/FROM TRAV 4/17/14: Crew travel to location
LOCATION

07:00 07:15 0.25 SAFETY MEETING RIG Safety meeting. Start equipment
07.15 08:15 1.00 MOVE R[G LOC Road rig &equipment 22 miles to location
08:15 09:15 1.00 RIG UP/DOWN LOC Spot in & rig up. Checkftp=300, fcp=300

09.15 12:30 3.25 NUIND BOP BOP Bleed well down. X-Oto 2 3/8" tubing equipment on rig & bop's. N.D well head. N.U 5k bop's.
R.U floor

12:30 14:15 1.75 TRIP TRP Pooh L.D tubinghanger. Pooh with 241 joint'sof2 3/8" J-55 tubing, F-nipple, 1 jointof 2 3/8" J-
55 tubing, L.D pump off bit sub

14:15 17:00 2.75 OTHER WL WORK LOG M.I.R,ULone wolf wire line. R.I.Hwith 3.625 gage ring to 7350'. Pooh L.D gage ring. Make up
& R.I.H with 4 1/2" CIBP set plug @7330'.Per Cutters wire line CBL dated 11-06-01. Pooh

17:00 18 00 1.00 CIRCULATE/CONDI CIRC R.U rig pump to casing. Fillcasing with 110 bbts of2% kcl water. Pressure test casing to 4300
TION #psi. Good test. Bleed off

18:00 20:30 2.50 OTHER WLWORK LOG R.U wire line. Make 2 run's to dump bail 5 sx of cement on topof CIBP @7330'.EST cement
top @7280'.Pooh R.D wire line. Clean up. S.W.I.F.N

20:30 21:30 1.00 DRIVE TOlFROM TRAV Crew travel to town
LOCATION

Other in .Hole Run (Bridge Plugs,.etc)
Run Time Des CD (in) Top (ft, KB} : Btm(ft, KB)

12:30 Bridge Plug - Permanent 4 7,330.0

QEP Energy Cornpany Page 1/1 Report Printed: 10/27/2014
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RECEIVED: Oct. 27, 2014

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

4/18/2014 06:00 - 4/19/2014 06:00
OEP Energy Cornpany

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report# 2
API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well ConfigurationType
43-047-33954 S17-TBS-R21E GYPSUM HILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Unique We[IID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KB to CF (ft) Spud Date Final Drlg Rig Release Total Depth (All)(ft, KB)
UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothemote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE -7,850.0
Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Date
AFE - REC (completion) STlMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RIG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) DailyField Est Total (Cost) Cum Field Est To Date (Cost)
REC-00085 14,488.38 30,803.03
Operations at Report Tlme Remarks
sicp=D, sitp=0 Shot new perfs from 6063'-67, 6052'-50', 6019'-17',
Operations Summary
4/21/14: SICP=0, R.I.H with 182 joint's of2 3/8" J-55 tubing. Pooh L.D 54 JoÌnts& R.I.H with remaining 54 joint's. Pooh &L.D 242 joint'sof 2 3/8" J-55 tubing
total. R.D floor. N.D bop's. N.U 7 1/16 5k frac tree. M.LR.UCameron test truck. Pressure test tree &casing to 5000 #psi. Good test. Bleed off. MJ.R.U Lone
wolf wire line. R.I.H with 3 1/8" perf gun 4 spf, 90 deg phase. Shot new perfs from 6063'-61', 6052'-50', 6019'-17', Per Cutters wire line CBL dated 11-06-01. O
pressure increase on well. Pooh R.D wire line. Shut well in for frac. Rig down & rack out equipment. S.W.I.F.F

Dally Readingse
Weather Temperature (°F) Road Condition Tub[ng Pressure (psi) Casing Pressure (psi) RigTlme (br)
Clear 72.0 Dry 0.0 0.0 10.00
Dally Contacts

Job Contabt Otle ., Mobile

Tom Jones Supervisor 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell Tool Pusher . . 435 828 7848

Time Loq ·

Start Time End Time Dur (hr) Activity Code . . : Com
06:00 07:00 1.00 DRIVE TO/FROM TRAV 4/21/14: Crew travelto location

LOCATION
07:00 07:15 0.25 SAFETY MEETING RIG Safety meeting. Check sicp=0. Open well up
07:15 12:00 4.75 TRIP TRP R.I,Hwith 182 joint's of 2 3/8" J-55 tubing. Pooh L.D 54 joints & R.I.H with rema ning 54 joint's.

Pooh &L.D 242 joint's of 2 3/8" J-SS tubingtotal
12:00 13:30 1.50 NU/ND BOP BOP R.D floor. N.D bop's. N.U 7 1/16 5k frac tree.
13:30 14:00 0.50 PRESSURE TEST EQT M.I.R.UCameron test truck.Pressure test casing &frac tree to 5000 #psi. Good test. Bleed off.

CASING
14:00 15:30 1.50 WL PERFORATE PERF M.I.R.U Lone wolf wire line. R.I.H with 3 1/8" perf gun 4 spf, 90 deg phase, Shot new perfs

from 6063'-61', 6052'-50', 6019'-17', Per Cutters wire line CBL dated 11-06-01.0 pressure
increase on well. Pooh R.Dwire line, Shut well in for frac

15:30 16:30 1.00 RIG UPIDOWN LOC Rig down rack out equipment & clean up location

QEP Energy Company Page 111 Report Printed: 10127/2014
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07:15 12:00 4.75 TRIP TRP R.I,Hwith 182 joint's of 2 3/8" J-55 tubing. Pooh L.D 54 joints & R.I.H with rema ning 54 joint's.

Pooh &L.D 242 joint's of 2 3/8" J-SS tubingtotal
12:00 13:30 1.50 NU/ND BOP BOP R.D floor. N.D bop's. N.U 7 1/16 5k frac tree.
13:30 14:00 0.50 PRESSURE TEST EQT M.I.R.UCameron test truck.Pressure test casing &frac tree to 5000 #psi. Good test. Bleed off.

CASING
14:00 15:30 1.50 WL PERFORATE PERF M.I.R.U Lone wolf wire line. R.I.H with 3 1/8" perf gun 4 spf, 90 deg phase, Shot new perfs

from 6063'-61', 6052'-50', 6019'-17', Per Cutters wire line CBL dated 11-06-01.0 pressure
increase on well. Pooh R.Dwire line, Shut well in for frac

15:30 16:30 1.00 RIG UPIDOWN LOC Rig down rack out equipment & clean up location

QEP Energy Company Page 111 Report Printed: 10127/2014

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

4/18/2014 06:00 - 4/19/2014 06:00
OEP Energy Cornpany

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report# 2
API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well ConfigurationType
43-047-33954 S17-TBS-R21E GYPSUM HILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Unique We[IID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KB to CF (ft) Spud Date Final Drlg Rig Release Total Depth (All)(ft, KB)
UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothemote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE -7,850.0
Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Date
AFE - REC (completion) STlMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RIG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) DailyField Est Total (Cost) Cum Field Est To Date (Cost)
REC-00085 14,488.38 30,803.03
Operations at Report Tlme Remarks
sicp=D, sitp=0 Shot new perfs from 6063'-67, 6052'-50', 6019'-17',
Operations Summary
4/21/14: SICP=0, R.I.H with 182 joint's of2 3/8" J-55 tubing. Pooh L.D 54 JoÌnts& R.I.H with remaining 54 joint's. Pooh &L.D 242 joint'sof 2 3/8" J-55 tubing
total. R.D floor. N.D bop's. N.U 7 1/16 5k frac tree. M.LR.UCameron test truck. Pressure test tree &casing to 5000 #psi. Good test. Bleed off. MJ.R.U Lone
wolf wire line. R.I.H with 3 1/8" perf gun 4 spf, 90 deg phase. Shot new perfs from 6063'-61', 6052'-50', 6019'-17', Per Cutters wire line CBL dated 11-06-01. O
pressure increase on well. Pooh R.D wire line. Shut well in for frac. Rig down & rack out equipment. S.W.I.F.F

Dally Readingse
Weather Temperature (°F) Road Condition Tub[ng Pressure (psi) Casing Pressure (psi) RigTlme (br)
Clear 72.0 Dry 0.0 0.0 10.00
Dally Contacts

Job Contabt Otle ., Mobile

Tom Jones Supervisor 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell Tool Pusher . . 435 828 7848

Time Loq ·

Start Time End Time Dur (hr) Activity Code . . : Com
06:00 07:00 1.00 DRIVE TO/FROM TRAV 4/21/14: Crew travelto location

LOCATION
07:00 07:15 0.25 SAFETY MEETING RIG Safety meeting. Check sicp=0. Open well up
07:15 12:00 4.75 TRIP TRP R.I,Hwith 182 joint's of 2 3/8" J-55 tubing. Pooh L.D 54 joints & R.I.H with rema ning 54 joint's.

Pooh &L.D 242 joint's of 2 3/8" J-SS tubingtotal
12:00 13:30 1.50 NU/ND BOP BOP R.D floor. N.D bop's. N.U 7 1/16 5k frac tree.
13:30 14:00 0.50 PRESSURE TEST EQT M.I.R.UCameron test truck.Pressure test casing &frac tree to 5000 #psi. Good test. Bleed off.

CASING
14:00 15:30 1.50 WL PERFORATE PERF M.I.R.U Lone wolf wire line. R.I.H with 3 1/8" perf gun 4 spf, 90 deg phase, Shot new perfs

from 6063'-61', 6052'-50', 6019'-17', Per Cutters wire line CBL dated 11-06-01.0 pressure
increase on well. Pooh R.Dwire line, Shut well in for frac

15:30 16:30 1.00 RIG UPIDOWN LOC Rig down rack out equipment & clean up location

QEP Energy Company Page 111 Report Printed: 10127/2014

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,



RECEIVED: Oct. 27, 2014

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

4/19/2014 06:00 - 4/20/2014 06:00
OEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report# 3

API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Configuration Type
43-047-33954 S17-T8S-R21E GYPSUMHILLS UINTAH UTAH Verl¡cal
l)nique Well ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KBtoCF (ft) Spud Date Final Drig Rig Release Total Depth (All) (ft, KB)

UT102700 4,688 4,703 00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:DD 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE -7,850.0
Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Dale
AFE - REC (completion) STIMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RIG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) DailyField Est Total (Cost) Cum Field EstTO Date (Cost)
REC-00085 136,115.94 166,918.97
Operations at Report Time Remarks

Operations Summary
ROADBASE
Daily Readings
Weather Temperature ("F) Road Condition Tubing Pressure (psi) Casing Pressure (pei) RigTime (hr)

Dry
Daily Contacts

Job Contact .: Tltle Motiile
Tom Jones Supervisor 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell ; . Tool Pusher ,

. . 435 828 7848

Time Log
Start Tirne End Time Dur (hr) Activity Code Com

QEP Energy company Page 111 Report Printed: 10/27/2014

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

4/19/2014 06:00 - 4/20/2014 06:00
OEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report# 3

API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Configuration Type
43-047-33954 S17-T8S-R21E GYPSUMHILLS UINTAH UTAH Verl¡cal
l)nique Well ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KBtoCF (ft) Spud Date Final Drig Rig Release Total Depth (All) (ft, KB)

UT102700 4,688 4,703 00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:DD 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE -7,850.0
Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Dale
AFE - REC (completion) STIMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RIG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) DailyField Est Total (Cost) Cum Field EstTO Date (Cost)
REC-00085 136,115.94 166,918.97
Operations at Report Time Remarks

Operations Summary
ROADBASE
Daily Readings
Weather Temperature ("F) Road Condition Tubing Pressure (psi) Casing Pressure (pei) RigTime (hr)

Dry
Daily Contacts

Job Contact .: Tltle Motiile
Tom Jones Supervisor 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell ; . Tool Pusher ,

. . 435 828 7848

Time Log
Start Tirne End Time Dur (hr) Activity Code Com

QEP Energy company Page 111 Report Printed: 10/27/2014

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

4/19/2014 06:00 - 4/20/2014 06:00
OEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report# 3

API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Configuration Type
43-047-33954 S17-T8S-R21E GYPSUMHILLS UINTAH UTAH Verl¡cal
l)nique Well ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KBtoCF (ft) Spud Date Final Drig Rig Release Total Depth (All) (ft, KB)

UT102700 4,688 4,703 00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:DD 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE -7,850.0
Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Dale
AFE - REC (completion) STIMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RIG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) DailyField Est Total (Cost) Cum Field EstTO Date (Cost)
REC-00085 136,115.94 166,918.97
Operations at Report Time Remarks

Operations Summary
ROADBASE
Daily Readings
Weather Temperature ("F) Road Condition Tubing Pressure (psi) Casing Pressure (pei) RigTime (hr)

Dry
Daily Contacts

Job Contact .: Tltle Motiile
Tom Jones Supervisor 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell ; . Tool Pusher ,

. . 435 828 7848

Time Log
Start Tirne End Time Dur (hr) Activity Code Com

QEP Energy company Page 111 Report Printed: 10/27/2014

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,



RECEIVED: Oct. 27, 2014

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/3/2014 06:00 - 5/4/2014 06:00
OEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report# 4

API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Condguration Type
43-047-33954 S17-TBS-R21E GYPSUM HILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Un que Well ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KB to CF (ft) Spud Date Final Drlg Rig Release Total Depth (All)(ft, KB)
UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGlNAL HOLE -7,850.0
Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Stad Date Job End Data
AFE - REC (completion) STIMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RIG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Nurnber Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) Daity Field Est Total (Cast) Cum Field Est TO Date (Cost)
REC-00085 202,709 32 369,628.29
Operations at Report Time Remarks

Fracing well
Operations Summary
Prime up and test HES main line to 4,600 psi. Good test. Frac stage #1. Plug, perf and frac stageS #2 thn]#4. SIW for 3 hrs and open up to flowback tank.At
report ttme, flowing well to flowback tank.

Daily Readings
Weather Temperature (F) Road Condttien Tubing Pressure (psi) Casing Pressure (psi) Rig11me (hr)

Dry
Daily Contacts

Job Coniact Title Mobile
Tom Jones Supervisor 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell Tool Pusher 435 828 7848 -
Time.Loa .
StartTLme End Time . -Dur(hr) Activity Code ; Com

06:00 09:00 3.00 SET FRAC STIM MIRULone Wolf ELUand HES frac equipment. Prime up and test HES main line to 4,6DO psi.
EQUIPMENT Good test.

09:00 09:30 0.50 FRACTURE STIM FRAC STAGE 1 (6,017 -6,063') WITH504 BBLS DELTA 140 CARRYING30,000 LBS 20/40
PREMIUM WHITE. OPEN WELL WITH0 PSI AND BREAKDOWNPERFSAT 1,811 PSI. AVG.
RATE = 30.8 BPM ANDAVG PRESSURE = 2,397 PSI. ISlP -2,131 PSI. FG -0.79

09:30 11:00 1.50 WL PERFORATE PERF STAGE 2 (5,451'-5,844') MUHES 4.50" CFP AND (10) 2', 2', 2', 2', 2', 2', 2', f, 2' AND 3'
LONE WOLF ELU TAG GUNS LOADED 4 SPF AND 90* PHASING. TEST LUBE TO 5,000
PSI. RIH AND SET CFP AT 5,870' WITH 2,200 PSI. PERFORATE STAGE #2 FROM 5,451'
TO 5,844'. POOH.

11:00 11:30 0.50 FRACTURE STIM FRAC STAGE 2 (5,4513-5,844') WITH 1,265 BBLS DELTA140 CARRYlNG 93,200 LBS
20/40 PREMIUMWHITE. OPEN WELL WITH 1,094 PSI AND BREAKDOWN PERFS AT 2,602
PSI. AVG. RATE = 60.0 BPM AND AVG. PRESSURE = 3,435 PSl. 1SIP-1,549 PSI. FG -
0.71

11:30 12:30 1.00 WL PERFORATE PERF STAGE 3 (5,063'-5,180') MU HES 4.50" CFP AND(5) 2', 2', 2', 2' AND 3' LONE WOLF ELU
TAG GUNS LOADED4 SPF AND 90* PHASING. TEST LUBE TO 5,000 PSI. RIH AND SET
CFP AT 5,200' WITH 1,400 PSI. PERFORATE STAGE #3 FROM 5,063' TO 5,180'. POOH

12:30 13:15 0.75 FRACTURE STIM FRAC STAGE 3 (5,063'-5,180') WITH 1,583 BBLS DELTA 140 CARRYlNG 125,100 LBS
20140 PREMIUM WHITE. OPEN WELLWITH 1,140 PSI AND BREAKDOWNPERFS AT 3,659
PSI. AVG. RATE = 50.5 BPM AND AVG. PRESSURE = 3,005 PSI. ISIP-1,988 PSI. FG -

0.82

13:15 14:15 1.00 WL PERFORATE PERF STAGE 4 (4,425-4,820') MU HES 4.5D" CFP AND (5) 2', 4', 4', 4' AND2' LONE WOLF ELU
TC AGU4NSLO ED14 S00F AND 9EOPOH NEGTAESE#L4UFRETMO 0200 PSI AND SHET

14:15 15:00 0.75 FRACTURE STIM FRAC STAGE 4 (4,426'-4,820') WITH 1,490 BBLS DELTA 140 CARRYlNG 132,020 LBS
20/40 PREMIUMWHITE. OPEN WELL WITH 1,720 PSI AND BREAKOOWN PERFS AT 3,420
PSI. AVG. RATE = 63.7 BPM AND AVG. PRESSURE = 2,683 PSI. ISIP-1,313 PSI FG -
0.72

15:00 19:00 4,00 RIG UP/DOWN LOC RDMO Lone Wolf ELU and HES frac equipment.
19:00 05:30 10.50 FLOWTEST PTST At report time, flowing well to flowback tank.

QEP Energy Company Page 1/1 Report Printed: 10/27/2014

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/3/2014 06:00 - 5/4/2014 06:00
OEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report# 4

API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Condguration Type
43-047-33954 S17-TBS-R21E GYPSUM HILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Un que Well ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KB to CF (ft) Spud Date Final Drlg Rig Release Total Depth (All)(ft, KB)
UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGlNAL HOLE -7,850.0
Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Stad Date Job End Data
AFE - REC (completion) STIMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RIG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Nurnber Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) Daity Field Est Total (Cast) Cum Field Est TO Date (Cost)
REC-00085 202,709 32 369,628.29
Operations at Report Time Remarks

Fracing well
Operations Summary
Prime up and test HES main line to 4,600 psi. Good test. Frac stage #1. Plug, perf and frac stageS #2 thn]#4. SIW for 3 hrs and open up to flowback tank.At
report ttme, flowing well to flowback tank.

Daily Readings
Weather Temperature (F) Road Condttien Tubing Pressure (psi) Casing Pressure (psi) Rig11me (hr)

Dry
Daily Contacts

Job Coniact Title Mobile
Tom Jones Supervisor 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell Tool Pusher 435 828 7848 -
Time.Loa .
StartTLme End Time . -Dur(hr) Activity Code ; Com

06:00 09:00 3.00 SET FRAC STIM MIRULone Wolf ELUand HES frac equipment. Prime up and test HES main line to 4,6DO psi.
EQUIPMENT Good test.

09:00 09:30 0.50 FRACTURE STIM FRAC STAGE 1 (6,017 -6,063') WITH504 BBLS DELTA 140 CARRYING30,000 LBS 20/40
PREMIUM WHITE. OPEN WELL WITH0 PSI AND BREAKDOWNPERFSAT 1,811 PSI. AVG.
RATE = 30.8 BPM ANDAVG PRESSURE = 2,397 PSI. ISlP -2,131 PSI. FG -0.79

09:30 11:00 1.50 WL PERFORATE PERF STAGE 2 (5,451'-5,844') MUHES 4.50" CFP AND (10) 2', 2', 2', 2', 2', 2', 2', f, 2' AND 3'
LONE WOLF ELU TAG GUNS LOADED 4 SPF AND 90* PHASING. TEST LUBE TO 5,000
PSI. RIH AND SET CFP AT 5,870' WITH 2,200 PSI. PERFORATE STAGE #2 FROM 5,451'
TO 5,844'. POOH.

11:00 11:30 0.50 FRACTURE STIM FRAC STAGE 2 (5,4513-5,844') WITH 1,265 BBLS DELTA140 CARRYlNG 93,200 LBS
20/40 PREMIUMWHITE. OPEN WELL WITH 1,094 PSI AND BREAKDOWN PERFS AT 2,602
PSI. AVG. RATE = 60.0 BPM AND AVG. PRESSURE = 3,435 PSl. 1SIP-1,549 PSI. FG -
0.71

11:30 12:30 1.00 WL PERFORATE PERF STAGE 3 (5,063'-5,180') MU HES 4.50" CFP AND(5) 2', 2', 2', 2' AND 3' LONE WOLF ELU
TAG GUNS LOADED4 SPF AND 90* PHASING. TEST LUBE TO 5,000 PSI. RIH AND SET
CFP AT 5,200' WITH 1,400 PSI. PERFORATE STAGE #3 FROM 5,063' TO 5,180'. POOH

12:30 13:15 0.75 FRACTURE STIM FRAC STAGE 3 (5,063'-5,180') WITH 1,583 BBLS DELTA 140 CARRYlNG 125,100 LBS
20140 PREMIUM WHITE. OPEN WELLWITH 1,140 PSI AND BREAKDOWNPERFS AT 3,659
PSI. AVG. RATE = 50.5 BPM AND AVG. PRESSURE = 3,005 PSI. ISIP-1,988 PSI. FG -

0.82

13:15 14:15 1.00 WL PERFORATE PERF STAGE 4 (4,425-4,820') MU HES 4.5D" CFP AND (5) 2', 4', 4', 4' AND2' LONE WOLF ELU
TC AGU4NSLO ED14 S00F AND 9EOPOH NEGTAESE#L4UFRETMO 0200 PSI AND SHET

14:15 15:00 0.75 FRACTURE STIM FRAC STAGE 4 (4,426'-4,820') WITH 1,490 BBLS DELTA 140 CARRYlNG 132,020 LBS
20/40 PREMIUMWHITE. OPEN WELL WITH 1,720 PSI AND BREAKOOWN PERFS AT 3,420
PSI. AVG. RATE = 63.7 BPM AND AVG. PRESSURE = 2,683 PSI. ISIP-1,313 PSI FG -
0.72

15:00 19:00 4,00 RIG UP/DOWN LOC RDMO Lone Wolf ELU and HES frac equipment.
19:00 05:30 10.50 FLOWTEST PTST At report time, flowing well to flowback tank.

QEP Energy Company Page 1/1 Report Printed: 10/27/2014

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/3/2014 06:00 - 5/4/2014 06:00
OEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report# 4

API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Condguration Type
43-047-33954 S17-TBS-R21E GYPSUM HILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Un que Well ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KB to CF (ft) Spud Date Final Drlg Rig Release Total Depth (All)(ft, KB)
UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGlNAL HOLE -7,850.0
Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Stad Date Job End Data
AFE - REC (completion) STIMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RIG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Nurnber Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) Daity Field Est Total (Cast) Cum Field Est TO Date (Cost)
REC-00085 202,709 32 369,628.29
Operations at Report Time Remarks

Fracing well
Operations Summary
Prime up and test HES main line to 4,600 psi. Good test. Frac stage #1. Plug, perf and frac stageS #2 thn]#4. SIW for 3 hrs and open up to flowback tank.At
report ttme, flowing well to flowback tank.

Daily Readings
Weather Temperature (F) Road Condttien Tubing Pressure (psi) Casing Pressure (psi) Rig11me (hr)

Dry
Daily Contacts

Job Coniact Title Mobile
Tom Jones Supervisor 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell Tool Pusher 435 828 7848 -
Time.Loa .
StartTLme End Time . -Dur(hr) Activity Code ; Com

06:00 09:00 3.00 SET FRAC STIM MIRULone Wolf ELUand HES frac equipment. Prime up and test HES main line to 4,6DO psi.
EQUIPMENT Good test.

09:00 09:30 0.50 FRACTURE STIM FRAC STAGE 1 (6,017 -6,063') WITH504 BBLS DELTA 140 CARRYING30,000 LBS 20/40
PREMIUM WHITE. OPEN WELL WITH0 PSI AND BREAKDOWNPERFSAT 1,811 PSI. AVG.
RATE = 30.8 BPM ANDAVG PRESSURE = 2,397 PSI. ISlP -2,131 PSI. FG -0.79

09:30 11:00 1.50 WL PERFORATE PERF STAGE 2 (5,451'-5,844') MUHES 4.50" CFP AND (10) 2', 2', 2', 2', 2', 2', 2', f, 2' AND 3'
LONE WOLF ELU TAG GUNS LOADED 4 SPF AND 90* PHASING. TEST LUBE TO 5,000
PSI. RIH AND SET CFP AT 5,870' WITH 2,200 PSI. PERFORATE STAGE #2 FROM 5,451'
TO 5,844'. POOH.

11:00 11:30 0.50 FRACTURE STIM FRAC STAGE 2 (5,4513-5,844') WITH 1,265 BBLS DELTA140 CARRYlNG 93,200 LBS
20/40 PREMIUMWHITE. OPEN WELL WITH 1,094 PSI AND BREAKDOWN PERFS AT 2,602
PSI. AVG. RATE = 60.0 BPM AND AVG. PRESSURE = 3,435 PSl. 1SIP-1,549 PSI. FG -
0.71

11:30 12:30 1.00 WL PERFORATE PERF STAGE 3 (5,063'-5,180') MU HES 4.50" CFP AND(5) 2', 2', 2', 2' AND 3' LONE WOLF ELU
TAG GUNS LOADED4 SPF AND 90* PHASING. TEST LUBE TO 5,000 PSI. RIH AND SET
CFP AT 5,200' WITH 1,400 PSI. PERFORATE STAGE #3 FROM 5,063' TO 5,180'. POOH

12:30 13:15 0.75 FRACTURE STIM FRAC STAGE 3 (5,063'-5,180') WITH 1,583 BBLS DELTA 140 CARRYlNG 125,100 LBS
20140 PREMIUM WHITE. OPEN WELLWITH 1,140 PSI AND BREAKDOWNPERFS AT 3,659
PSI. AVG. RATE = 50.5 BPM AND AVG. PRESSURE = 3,005 PSI. ISIP-1,988 PSI. FG -

0.82

13:15 14:15 1.00 WL PERFORATE PERF STAGE 4 (4,425-4,820') MU HES 4.5D" CFP AND (5) 2', 4', 4', 4' AND2' LONE WOLF ELU
TC AGU4NSLO ED14 S00F AND 9EOPOH NEGTAESE#L4UFRETMO 0200 PSI AND SHET

14:15 15:00 0.75 FRACTURE STIM FRAC STAGE 4 (4,426'-4,820') WITH 1,490 BBLS DELTA 140 CARRYlNG 132,020 LBS
20/40 PREMIUMWHITE. OPEN WELL WITH 1,720 PSI AND BREAKOOWN PERFS AT 3,420
PSI. AVG. RATE = 63.7 BPM AND AVG. PRESSURE = 2,683 PSI. ISIP-1,313 PSI FG -
0.72

15:00 19:00 4,00 RIG UP/DOWN LOC RDMO Lone Wolf ELU and HES frac equipment.
19:00 05:30 10.50 FLOWTEST PTST At report time, flowing well to flowback tank.

QEP Energy Company Page 1/1 Report Printed: 10/27/2014

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,



RECEIVED: Oct. 27, 2014

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/5/2014 06:00 - 5/6/2014 06:00
OEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report# 5

API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Contiguration Type
43-047-33954 S17-T8S-R21E GYPSUM HILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Unique Well ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevetion KB to CF (ft) Spod Date Final Drig Rig Release Total Depth (AII)(ft, KB)
UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE -7,850.0
Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Date
AFE - REC (completion) STIMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RIG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) DailyField Est Total (Cost) Cum Field EstTo Date (Cost)
REC-OOD85 14,702.11 384,330.40
Operations et Report Time Remarks
MIRU
Operations Summary
5/5/14: SICP= 300# psi. Bleed well down. MIRU.ND frac tree. NU 5k bop's. RU floor &tubing equip. Spot in tubingtrailer.Tally & make up 3 5/8" rock bit & bit
sub. Rabbit & pick up 58 jo nt's of 2 3/8" J-55 tubing. EOT @1850'.Shut down do to rig sinking. Build up base on rig with fill dirt. SWIFN
Daily Readings
Weether Temperature ("F) Road Candition Tubing Pressure (psi) Casing Pressure (psi) RigTime (hr)
Clear 48.0 Dry 0.0 300.0 13.50
Daily Contacts

Job Contact . Title
.

Mobile
TomJones Supemisor 4358235400
Ba×ter Powell Tool Pusher

, 435 828 7848
Tima Log
Start Time End Time- Dur (br) Activity Code .

. Cdm
06:00 07:00 1.00 DRIVE TOlFROM TRAV 5/5/14: Travel to location.

LOCATION

07:00 07:15 0.25 SAFETY MEETING RIG Safety meeting:
Topic: RU Power swivel
SICP= 3DO# psi. Opened well up on a full 2".

07:15 09:30 2.25 RIG UP/DOWN LOC Moved rig 1-mile to location. Spot in equipment, MIRU. Back end of rig started to sink, had to
RD and sure up ground around wellhead. MIRU.

09:30 12.D0 2.50 NU/ND BOP BOP ND frac tree. NU 5k bop's. RU floor &tubing equip.
12:00 15:30 3.50 PU/LD TUBING TRP Spot in tubing trailer. Tally & make up 3 5/8" rock bit & bit sub. Rabbit & pick up 58 joint's of 2

3/8" J-55 tubing. Shut well in do to rig sinking, EOT @1850'
15:30 18:30 3.00 WAITING ON FILL WOT Wait for fill dirt. Build up base for rig. Level up rig. Clean up. SDFN
18:30 19:30 1.00 DRIVE TO/FROM TRAV Crew travel to town

LOCATION

QEP Energy Company Page 1/1 Report Printed: 10/27/2014

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/5/2014 06:00 - 5/6/2014 06:00
OEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report# 5

API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Contiguration Type
43-047-33954 S17-T8S-R21E GYPSUM HILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Unique Well ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevetion KB to CF (ft) Spod Date Final Drig Rig Release Total Depth (AII)(ft, KB)
UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE -7,850.0
Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Date
AFE - REC (completion) STIMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RIG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) DailyField Est Total (Cost) Cum Field EstTo Date (Cost)
REC-OOD85 14,702.11 384,330.40
Operations et Report Time Remarks
MIRU
Operations Summary
5/5/14: SICP= 300# psi. Bleed well down. MIRU.ND frac tree. NU 5k bop's. RU floor &tubing equip. Spot in tubingtrailer.Tally & make up 3 5/8" rock bit & bit
sub. Rabbit & pick up 58 jo nt's of 2 3/8" J-55 tubing. EOT @1850'.Shut down do to rig sinking. Build up base on rig with fill dirt. SWIFN
Daily Readings
Weether Temperature ("F) Road Candition Tubing Pressure (psi) Casing Pressure (psi) RigTime (hr)
Clear 48.0 Dry 0.0 300.0 13.50
Daily Contacts

Job Contact . Title
.

Mobile
TomJones Supemisor 4358235400
Ba×ter Powell Tool Pusher

, 435 828 7848
Tima Log
Start Time End Time- Dur (br) Activity Code .

. Cdm
06:00 07:00 1.00 DRIVE TOlFROM TRAV 5/5/14: Travel to location.

LOCATION

07:00 07:15 0.25 SAFETY MEETING RIG Safety meeting:
Topic: RU Power swivel
SICP= 3DO# psi. Opened well up on a full 2".

07:15 09:30 2.25 RIG UP/DOWN LOC Moved rig 1-mile to location. Spot in equipment, MIRU. Back end of rig started to sink, had to
RD and sure up ground around wellhead. MIRU.

09:30 12.D0 2.50 NU/ND BOP BOP ND frac tree. NU 5k bop's. RU floor &tubing equip.
12:00 15:30 3.50 PU/LD TUBING TRP Spot in tubing trailer. Tally & make up 3 5/8" rock bit & bit sub. Rabbit & pick up 58 joint's of 2

3/8" J-55 tubing. Shut well in do to rig sinking, EOT @1850'
15:30 18:30 3.00 WAITING ON FILL WOT Wait for fill dirt. Build up base for rig. Level up rig. Clean up. SDFN
18:30 19:30 1.00 DRIVE TO/FROM TRAV Crew travel to town

LOCATION

QEP Energy Company Page 1/1 Report Printed: 10/27/2014

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/5/2014 06:00 - 5/6/2014 06:00
OEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report# 5

API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Contiguration Type
43-047-33954 S17-T8S-R21E GYPSUM HILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Unique Well ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevetion KB to CF (ft) Spod Date Final Drig Rig Release Total Depth (AII)(ft, KB)
UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE -7,850.0
Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Date
AFE - REC (completion) STIMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RIG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) DailyField Est Total (Cost) Cum Field EstTo Date (Cost)
REC-OOD85 14,702.11 384,330.40
Operations et Report Time Remarks
MIRU
Operations Summary
5/5/14: SICP= 300# psi. Bleed well down. MIRU.ND frac tree. NU 5k bop's. RU floor &tubing equip. Spot in tubingtrailer.Tally & make up 3 5/8" rock bit & bit
sub. Rabbit & pick up 58 jo nt's of 2 3/8" J-55 tubing. EOT @1850'.Shut down do to rig sinking. Build up base on rig with fill dirt. SWIFN
Daily Readings
Weether Temperature ("F) Road Candition Tubing Pressure (psi) Casing Pressure (psi) RigTime (hr)
Clear 48.0 Dry 0.0 300.0 13.50
Daily Contacts

Job Contact . Title
.

Mobile
TomJones Supemisor 4358235400
Ba×ter Powell Tool Pusher

, 435 828 7848
Tima Log
Start Time End Time- Dur (br) Activity Code .

. Cdm
06:00 07:00 1.00 DRIVE TOlFROM TRAV 5/5/14: Travel to location.

LOCATION

07:00 07:15 0.25 SAFETY MEETING RIG Safety meeting:
Topic: RU Power swivel
SICP= 3DO# psi. Opened well up on a full 2".

07:15 09:30 2.25 RIG UP/DOWN LOC Moved rig 1-mile to location. Spot in equipment, MIRU. Back end of rig started to sink, had to
RD and sure up ground around wellhead. MIRU.

09:30 12.D0 2.50 NU/ND BOP BOP ND frac tree. NU 5k bop's. RU floor &tubing equip.
12:00 15:30 3.50 PU/LD TUBING TRP Spot in tubing trailer. Tally & make up 3 5/8" rock bit & bit sub. Rabbit & pick up 58 joint's of 2

3/8" J-55 tubing. Shut well in do to rig sinking, EOT @1850'
15:30 18:30 3.00 WAITING ON FILL WOT Wait for fill dirt. Build up base for rig. Level up rig. Clean up. SDFN
18:30 19:30 1.00 DRIVE TO/FROM TRAV Crew travel to town

LOCATION

QEP Energy Company Page 1/1 Report Printed: 10/27/2014

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,



RECEIVED: Oct. 27, 2014

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/6/2014 06:00 - 5/7/2014 06:00
OEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report# 6

API Surface Legal Location Ffeld Name County State Well Cor guratton Type
43-047-33954 S17-TSS-R21E GYPSUM HILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Unique Well ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KB to CF (ft) Spud Dale Final Orig RigRelease Total Depth (AII)(ft, KB)
UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE - 7,850.0
Primary Job Type Seconday Job Type Start Date Job End Date
AFE - REC (completion) STIMULATION 4117/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RIG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) Daily Field Est Total (Cost) Cum Field Est To Date (Cost)
REC-00085 8,718.63 393,049.03
Operations at Report Time Remarks
SICP=250, SITP=250 Clean out frac plug's
Operations Summary
5/6/14: SICP=250, SITP=250. Bleed well down. Continued to 138 joint'stag up on frac plug #1 @4836',Drillout in 20 min, Swivel in tag up on frac plug #2
@5198'.Drill out in 15 min. RIH tag up on frac plug #3 @5880'.Drillout in 15 min. Stand swivel back. RIH 33 joint's EOT @6696'.Roll hole clean. RD swivel.
Pooh LD 19 joint'sof 2 3/8" J-55 tubing. Pooh standing back 28 Jolnt's.EOT @4420'.SW1FN
Daily Readings
Weather Temperature (F) Road Condition Tubing Pressure (psg Casing Pressure (psi) Rig Time (hr)
Clear 79.0 DU 250.0 250.0 14.50
Daily Contacts ;

Job Contact Title Mobile .

Tom Jones Supervisor 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell . . Tool Pusher 435 828 7848

Time Log
Start11me End Time Dur (hr) . Activity . Code Com

06:00 07:00 1.00 DRIVE TO/FROM TRAV 5/6/14: Crew travel to location
LOCATION

07:00 07:15 0.25 SAFETY MEETING RIG Safety meeting. Check sicp=250, sitp=250.

07:15 07:30 0.25 CIRCULATEICONDI CIRC Bleed well off. Top killtubing with 10 bbl's.
TION

07:30 11:00 3.50 PU/LDTUBING TRP Talty & pick up 138 joint's of 2 3/8" J-55 tubing. Tag up on frac plug @4836'
11:00 11:30 0.50 RIG UP/DOWN SEQ RU swivel & rig pump Fill with 1 bbl's

SWIVEL
11:30 17:00 5.50 DRILL PLUG DRL Drill plug out in 20 min. Swivel in 10 joint'sof 2 3/8" J-55 tubingtag up on frac plug @2@5198'.

Drill plug out in 15 min. Stand swivel back. Tally& pick up 21 joint'stag up on frac plug #3
@5880'.RU swivel &pump. Drillplug out in 15 min. Stand swivel back. Tally & pick up 33
joint'sof 2 318" J,55 tubing.EOT @6696'

17:00 18:00 1.00 CIRCULATElCONDI CIRC Roll hole clean. RD swivel
TION

18:00 19:00 1.00 TRIP TRP Pooh LD 19 joint's of 2 3/8" J-55 tubing &standing back 28 Joint'sof 2 3/8" J-55 tubing.EOT
4420'. Clean up. SWlFN

19:00 20:00 1.00 DR)VE TO/FROM TRAV Crew travel to town
LOCATION

QEP Energy Company Page 1/1 Report Printed: 10/27/2014

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/6/2014 06:00 - 5/7/2014 06:00
OEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report# 6

API Surface Legal Location Ffeld Name County State Well Cor guratton Type
43-047-33954 S17-TSS-R21E GYPSUM HILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Unique Well ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KB to CF (ft) Spud Dale Final Orig RigRelease Total Depth (AII)(ft, KB)
UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE - 7,850.0
Primary Job Type Seconday Job Type Start Date Job End Date
AFE - REC (completion) STIMULATION 4117/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RIG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) Daily Field Est Total (Cost) Cum Field Est To Date (Cost)
REC-00085 8,718.63 393,049.03
Operations at Report Time Remarks
SICP=250, SITP=250 Clean out frac plug's
Operations Summary
5/6/14: SICP=250, SITP=250. Bleed well down. Continued to 138 joint'stag up on frac plug #1 @4836',Drillout in 20 min, Swivel in tag up on frac plug #2
@5198'.Drill out in 15 min. RIH tag up on frac plug #3 @5880'.Drillout in 15 min. Stand swivel back. RIH 33 joint's EOT @6696'.Roll hole clean. RD swivel.
Pooh LD 19 joint'sof 2 3/8" J-55 tubing. Pooh standing back 28 Jolnt's.EOT @4420'.SW1FN
Daily Readings
Weather Temperature (F) Road Condition Tubing Pressure (psg Casing Pressure (psi) Rig Time (hr)
Clear 79.0 DU 250.0 250.0 14.50
Daily Contacts ;

Job Contact Title Mobile .

Tom Jones Supervisor 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell . . Tool Pusher 435 828 7848

Time Log
Start11me End Time Dur (hr) . Activity . Code Com

06:00 07:00 1.00 DRIVE TO/FROM TRAV 5/6/14: Crew travel to location
LOCATION

07:00 07:15 0.25 SAFETY MEETING RIG Safety meeting. Check sicp=250, sitp=250.

07:15 07:30 0.25 CIRCULATEICONDI CIRC Bleed well off. Top killtubing with 10 bbl's.
TION

07:30 11:00 3.50 PU/LDTUBING TRP Talty & pick up 138 joint's of 2 3/8" J-55 tubing. Tag up on frac plug @4836'
11:00 11:30 0.50 RIG UP/DOWN SEQ RU swivel & rig pump Fill with 1 bbl's

SWIVEL
11:30 17:00 5.50 DRILL PLUG DRL Drill plug out in 20 min. Swivel in 10 joint'sof 2 3/8" J-55 tubingtag up on frac plug @2@5198'.

Drill plug out in 15 min. Stand swivel back. Tally& pick up 21 joint'stag up on frac plug #3
@5880'.RU swivel &pump. Drillplug out in 15 min. Stand swivel back. Tally & pick up 33
joint'sof 2 318" J,55 tubing.EOT @6696'

17:00 18:00 1.00 CIRCULATElCONDI CIRC Roll hole clean. RD swivel
TION

18:00 19:00 1.00 TRIP TRP Pooh LD 19 joint's of 2 3/8" J-55 tubing &standing back 28 Joint'sof 2 3/8" J-55 tubing.EOT
4420'. Clean up. SWlFN

19:00 20:00 1.00 DR)VE TO/FROM TRAV Crew travel to town
LOCATION

QEP Energy Company Page 1/1 Report Printed: 10/27/2014

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/6/2014 06:00 - 5/7/2014 06:00
OEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report# 6

API Surface Legal Location Ffeld Name County State Well Cor guratton Type
43-047-33954 S17-TSS-R21E GYPSUM HILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Unique Well ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KB to CF (ft) Spud Dale Final Orig RigRelease Total Depth (AII)(ft, KB)
UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE - 7,850.0
Primary Job Type Seconday Job Type Start Date Job End Date
AFE - REC (completion) STIMULATION 4117/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RIG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) Daily Field Est Total (Cost) Cum Field Est To Date (Cost)
REC-00085 8,718.63 393,049.03
Operations at Report Time Remarks
SICP=250, SITP=250 Clean out frac plug's
Operations Summary
5/6/14: SICP=250, SITP=250. Bleed well down. Continued to 138 joint'stag up on frac plug #1 @4836',Drillout in 20 min, Swivel in tag up on frac plug #2
@5198'.Drill out in 15 min. RIH tag up on frac plug #3 @5880'.Drillout in 15 min. Stand swivel back. RIH 33 joint's EOT @6696'.Roll hole clean. RD swivel.
Pooh LD 19 joint'sof 2 3/8" J-55 tubing. Pooh standing back 28 Jolnt's.EOT @4420'.SW1FN
Daily Readings
Weather Temperature (F) Road Condition Tubing Pressure (psg Casing Pressure (psi) Rig Time (hr)
Clear 79.0 DU 250.0 250.0 14.50
Daily Contacts ;

Job Contact Title Mobile .

Tom Jones Supervisor 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell . . Tool Pusher 435 828 7848

Time Log
Start11me End Time Dur (hr) . Activity . Code Com

06:00 07:00 1.00 DRIVE TO/FROM TRAV 5/6/14: Crew travel to location
LOCATION

07:00 07:15 0.25 SAFETY MEETING RIG Safety meeting. Check sicp=250, sitp=250.

07:15 07:30 0.25 CIRCULATEICONDI CIRC Bleed well off. Top killtubing with 10 bbl's.
TION

07:30 11:00 3.50 PU/LDTUBING TRP Talty & pick up 138 joint's of 2 3/8" J-55 tubing. Tag up on frac plug @4836'
11:00 11:30 0.50 RIG UP/DOWN SEQ RU swivel & rig pump Fill with 1 bbl's

SWIVEL
11:30 17:00 5.50 DRILL PLUG DRL Drill plug out in 20 min. Swivel in 10 joint'sof 2 3/8" J-55 tubingtag up on frac plug @2@5198'.

Drill plug out in 15 min. Stand swivel back. Tally& pick up 21 joint'stag up on frac plug #3
@5880'.RU swivel &pump. Drillplug out in 15 min. Stand swivel back. Tally & pick up 33
joint'sof 2 318" J,55 tubing.EOT @6696'

17:00 18:00 1.00 CIRCULATElCONDI CIRC Roll hole clean. RD swivel
TION

18:00 19:00 1.00 TRIP TRP Pooh LD 19 joint's of 2 3/8" J-55 tubing &standing back 28 Joint'sof 2 3/8" J-55 tubing.EOT
4420'. Clean up. SWlFN

19:00 20:00 1.00 DR)VE TO/FROM TRAV Crew travel to town
LOCATION

QEP Energy Company Page 1/1 Report Printed: 10/27/2014

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,



RECEIVED: Oct. 27, 2014

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/7/2014 06:00 - 5/8/2014 06:00
QEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report#7

API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Contguration Type
43-047-33954 S17-TBS-R21E GYPSUMHILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Unique Well 10 Gr Elev (ft) Current E[evation KB 10 CF (ft) Spad Date Final Drlg Rig Release Total Depth (All)(ft, KB)
UTiO2700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE - 7,850.0
Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Date
AFE - REC (completion) STLMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RtG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) DailyField Est Total (Cost) Cum Field Est To Date (Cost)
REC-00085 13,401.15 406,450.18
Operations at Report Time Remarks
SICP=40, SITP=15 EOT @6110,S-Nipple @6080',4 1/2" B-2 TAC @4400'
Operations Summary
5/7/14: SICP=40, SLTP=15. Top kill tubingwith 10 bbl's of 2% kcl water. Pooh with 160 joint'sof 2 3/8" J-55 tubing.LD bit & bit sub. Tally & make up production
tubing.RIHwith 2 3/8" collar, 1 jointof 2 3/8" J-55 tubing, S-nipple, 52 joint's, 4 1/2" B-2 tac, 138 joint's of 2 3/8" J-55 tubing. RD floor. ND bop's. Set4 1/2" B-2
tac 14k in ten. NU well head. XO to rod equip. Prime pump with chem. RIH with 2 x 1 1/2 x 20 RWAC, Have to strip well head nipple off to get pump in the
hole. Continued to pick up & RdHwith 16-7/8" plain rod's, 76- 3/4" plain rod's. Make up polish rod. SWIFN
Daily Readings
Weather Temperature (°F) Road Condition Tubing Pressure (psi) Casing Pressure (psi) Rig Time (hr)
Clear 67.0 Dry 15.0 40.0 14.00
Daily Contacts

Job Contact Title Mobile .
TomJones Supemisor 4358235400
Baxter Powell Tool Pusher

.
. ' 435 828 7848

Time Log
Stat Time -End Time : Dur (hr) Activtty Code . . Com

06:00 07:00 1.00 DRIVETO/FROM TRAV 5/7/14: Crew travelto location
LOCATION

07:00 07:15 0.25 SAFETY MEETING RIG Safety meeting. Check sicp=40, sitp=15. Bleed well off
07:15 07:30 0.25 CIRCULATE/CONDI CIRC RU rig pump to tubingtop killwith 10 bbl's of 2% kcl water

TION

07:30 D9:00 1.50 TRIP TRP Poch with remaining 160 joint'sof 2 3/8" J-55 tubing. LD bit & bit sub
09:00 12:30 3.50 TRIP TRP Tally & make up production tubing.RIH with 2 3/8" collar, 1 jointof 2 3/8" J-55 tubing, S-nipple,

52 Joint's,4 1/2" B-2 tac, 138 joint'sof 2 3/8" J-SS tubing
12:30 15:30 3.00 NU/ND BOP BOP RD floor. ND bop's. Set 4 1/2" B-2 tac 14k in ten. NUwell head.X O to rod equip
15:30 19:00 3,50 RUN/PULL PlJMP TRP Prime pump with chem. RIH with 2 x 1 1/2 x 20 RWAC, Have to strip well head nipple off to get

pump in the hole. Cont[nued to pick up &RIH with 16- 7/8" plain rod's, 76- 3/4" plain rod's.
Make up polish rod. SWIFN

19:00 20:00 1.00 DRIVE TO/FROM TRAV Crew travel to town
LOCATION

QEP Energy Company Page 1/1 Report Printed: 10/27/2014

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/7/2014 06:00 - 5/8/2014 06:00
QEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report#7

API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Contguration Type
43-047-33954 S17-TBS-R21E GYPSUMHILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Unique Well 10 Gr Elev (ft) Current E[evation KB 10 CF (ft) Spad Date Final Drlg Rig Release Total Depth (All)(ft, KB)
UTiO2700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE - 7,850.0
Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Date
AFE - REC (completion) STLMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RtG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) DailyField Est Total (Cost) Cum Field Est To Date (Cost)
REC-00085 13,401.15 406,450.18
Operations at Report Time Remarks
SICP=40, SITP=15 EOT @6110,S-Nipple @6080',4 1/2" B-2 TAC @4400'
Operations Summary
5/7/14: SICP=40, SLTP=15. Top kill tubingwith 10 bbl's of 2% kcl water. Pooh with 160 joint'sof 2 3/8" J-55 tubing.LD bit & bit sub. Tally & make up production
tubing.RIHwith 2 3/8" collar, 1 jointof 2 3/8" J-55 tubing, S-nipple, 52 joint's, 4 1/2" B-2 tac, 138 joint's of 2 3/8" J-55 tubing. RD floor. ND bop's. Set4 1/2" B-2
tac 14k in ten. NU well head. XO to rod equip. Prime pump with chem. RIH with 2 x 1 1/2 x 20 RWAC, Have to strip well head nipple off to get pump in the
hole. Continued to pick up & RdHwith 16-7/8" plain rod's, 76- 3/4" plain rod's. Make up polish rod. SWIFN
Daily Readings
Weather Temperature (°F) Road Condition Tubing Pressure (psi) Casing Pressure (psi) Rig Time (hr)
Clear 67.0 Dry 15.0 40.0 14.00
Daily Contacts

Job Contact Title Mobile .
TomJones Supemisor 4358235400
Baxter Powell Tool Pusher

.
. ' 435 828 7848

Time Log
Stat Time -End Time : Dur (hr) Activtty Code . . Com

06:00 07:00 1.00 DRIVETO/FROM TRAV 5/7/14: Crew travelto location
LOCATION

07:00 07:15 0.25 SAFETY MEETING RIG Safety meeting. Check sicp=40, sitp=15. Bleed well off
07:15 07:30 0.25 CIRCULATE/CONDI CIRC RU rig pump to tubingtop killwith 10 bbl's of 2% kcl water

TION

07:30 D9:00 1.50 TRIP TRP Poch with remaining 160 joint'sof 2 3/8" J-55 tubing. LD bit & bit sub
09:00 12:30 3.50 TRIP TRP Tally & make up production tubing.RIH with 2 3/8" collar, 1 jointof 2 3/8" J-55 tubing, S-nipple,

52 Joint's,4 1/2" B-2 tac, 138 joint'sof 2 3/8" J-SS tubing
12:30 15:30 3.00 NU/ND BOP BOP RD floor. ND bop's. Set 4 1/2" B-2 tac 14k in ten. NUwell head.X O to rod equip
15:30 19:00 3,50 RUN/PULL PlJMP TRP Prime pump with chem. RIH with 2 x 1 1/2 x 20 RWAC, Have to strip well head nipple off to get

pump in the hole. Cont[nued to pick up &RIH with 16- 7/8" plain rod's, 76- 3/4" plain rod's.
Make up polish rod. SWIFN

19:00 20:00 1.00 DRIVE TO/FROM TRAV Crew travel to town
LOCATION

QEP Energy Company Page 1/1 Report Printed: 10/27/2014

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/7/2014 06:00 - 5/8/2014 06:00
QEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report#7

API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Contguration Type
43-047-33954 S17-TBS-R21E GYPSUMHILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Unique Well 10 Gr Elev (ft) Current E[evation KB 10 CF (ft) Spad Date Final Drlg Rig Release Total Depth (All)(ft, KB)
UTiO2700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE - 7,850.0
Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Date
AFE - REC (completion) STLMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RtG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) DailyField Est Total (Cost) Cum Field Est To Date (Cost)
REC-00085 13,401.15 406,450.18
Operations at Report Time Remarks
SICP=40, SITP=15 EOT @6110,S-Nipple @6080',4 1/2" B-2 TAC @4400'
Operations Summary
5/7/14: SICP=40, SLTP=15. Top kill tubingwith 10 bbl's of 2% kcl water. Pooh with 160 joint'sof 2 3/8" J-55 tubing.LD bit & bit sub. Tally & make up production
tubing.RIHwith 2 3/8" collar, 1 jointof 2 3/8" J-55 tubing, S-nipple, 52 joint's, 4 1/2" B-2 tac, 138 joint's of 2 3/8" J-55 tubing. RD floor. ND bop's. Set4 1/2" B-2
tac 14k in ten. NU well head. XO to rod equip. Prime pump with chem. RIH with 2 x 1 1/2 x 20 RWAC, Have to strip well head nipple off to get pump in the
hole. Continued to pick up & RdHwith 16-7/8" plain rod's, 76- 3/4" plain rod's. Make up polish rod. SWIFN
Daily Readings
Weather Temperature (°F) Road Condition Tubing Pressure (psi) Casing Pressure (psi) Rig Time (hr)
Clear 67.0 Dry 15.0 40.0 14.00
Daily Contacts

Job Contact Title Mobile .
TomJones Supemisor 4358235400
Baxter Powell Tool Pusher

.
. ' 435 828 7848

Time Log
Stat Time -End Time : Dur (hr) Activtty Code . . Com

06:00 07:00 1.00 DRIVETO/FROM TRAV 5/7/14: Crew travelto location
LOCATION

07:00 07:15 0.25 SAFETY MEETING RIG Safety meeting. Check sicp=40, sitp=15. Bleed well off
07:15 07:30 0.25 CIRCULATE/CONDI CIRC RU rig pump to tubingtop killwith 10 bbl's of 2% kcl water

TION

07:30 D9:00 1.50 TRIP TRP Poch with remaining 160 joint'sof 2 3/8" J-55 tubing. LD bit & bit sub
09:00 12:30 3.50 TRIP TRP Tally & make up production tubing.RIH with 2 3/8" collar, 1 jointof 2 3/8" J-55 tubing, S-nipple,

52 Joint's,4 1/2" B-2 tac, 138 joint'sof 2 3/8" J-SS tubing
12:30 15:30 3.00 NU/ND BOP BOP RD floor. ND bop's. Set 4 1/2" B-2 tac 14k in ten. NUwell head.X O to rod equip
15:30 19:00 3,50 RUN/PULL PlJMP TRP Prime pump with chem. RIH with 2 x 1 1/2 x 20 RWAC, Have to strip well head nipple off to get

pump in the hole. Cont[nued to pick up &RIH with 16- 7/8" plain rod's, 76- 3/4" plain rod's.
Make up polish rod. SWIFN

19:00 20:00 1.00 DRIVE TO/FROM TRAV Crew travel to town
LOCATION

QEP Energy Company Page 1/1 Report Printed: 10/27/2014

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,



RECEIVED: Oct. 27, 2014

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/8/2014 06:00 - 5/9/2014 06:00
QEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report#8

API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Configuration Type
43-047-33954 S17-T8S-R21E GYPSUM HILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Unique WellID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KB to CF (ft) Spad Date Final Dríg Rig Release Total Depth (All) (ft, KB)

UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 1012912001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE -7,850.0

Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Date
AFE - REC (completion) STlMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RlG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) Daily FFeld Est Total (Cost) Cum Field Est To Date (Cost)
REC-00085 21,774.60 428,224.78
Operations at Report Time Remarks
SICP=0, SITP=0
Operations Summary
5/8/14: SICP=0, SITP=D, Stand polish rod back. Continued to pick up RIH with remaining rod string. Space out & seat rod pump. Long stroke pump to 1200
#psi in 4 stroke's. Good pump action. RU unit & adjust 16" off tag. Check unit. RDMOturn well over to production
Daily Readings
Weather Temperature (°F) Road Condition Tubtng Pressure (psi) Castng Pressure (psi) Rig Time (hr)
C ear 46.0 Dry 0.0 0.0
Daily Contacts

Job Contact . .
- Title Mobile -

Tom Jones Supervisor 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell . Tool Pusher 435 828 7848

Time Log
Start Time End Time Our (hr) Activity: Code ..

. Com
06:00 07:00 1.00 DRIVE TO/FROM TRAV 5/8/14: Grew travelto location

LOCATION
07:00 07:30 0.50 SAFETY MEETING RIG Safety meeting. Check SICP=0, SITP=0 Open well up
07:30 12:00 4.50 RUN/PULL PUMP TRP Stand polish Tod back. Continued to pick up & RIH with 67- 3/4" Plain rod's, 84- 7/8" plain rod's,

1- 8',6',4' x 7/8" pony sub's. 1 1/2" x 26' polish rod. Seat rod pump.
12:00 13:30 1.50 RiG UP/DOWN SEQ Hole standing full. Long stroke pump to 1200 #psi in 4 stroke's good pump action. RU pumping

PUMPING UNIT unit & adjust 16" tag. Check unÌt. Good
13:30 15:00 1.50 RIG UP/DOWN LOC Rig down & clean up location, Turn well over to production. Shut down to repair rig
15:00 16:00 1,00 DRIVE TOlFROM TRAV Crew travel to town

LOCATION
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RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/8/2014 06:00 - 5/9/2014 06:00
QEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report#8

API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Configuration Type
43-047-33954 S17-T8S-R21E GYPSUM HILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Unique WellID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KB to CF (ft) Spad Date Final Dríg Rig Release Total Depth (All) (ft, KB)

UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 1012912001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE -7,850.0

Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Date
AFE - REC (completion) STlMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RlG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) Daily FFeld Est Total (Cost) Cum Field Est To Date (Cost)
REC-00085 21,774.60 428,224.78
Operations at Report Time Remarks
SICP=0, SITP=0
Operations Summary
5/8/14: SICP=0, SITP=D, Stand polish rod back. Continued to pick up RIH with remaining rod string. Space out & seat rod pump. Long stroke pump to 1200
#psi in 4 stroke's. Good pump action. RU unit & adjust 16" off tag. Check unit. RDMOturn well over to production
Daily Readings
Weather Temperature (°F) Road Condition Tubtng Pressure (psi) Castng Pressure (psi) Rig Time (hr)
C ear 46.0 Dry 0.0 0.0
Daily Contacts

Job Contact . .
- Title Mobile -

Tom Jones Supervisor 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell . Tool Pusher 435 828 7848

Time Log
Start Time End Time Our (hr) Activity: Code ..

. Com
06:00 07:00 1.00 DRIVE TO/FROM TRAV 5/8/14: Grew travelto location

LOCATION
07:00 07:30 0.50 SAFETY MEETING RIG Safety meeting. Check SICP=0, SITP=0 Open well up
07:30 12:00 4.50 RUN/PULL PUMP TRP Stand polish Tod back. Continued to pick up & RIH with 67- 3/4" Plain rod's, 84- 7/8" plain rod's,

1- 8',6',4' x 7/8" pony sub's. 1 1/2" x 26' polish rod. Seat rod pump.
12:00 13:30 1.50 RiG UP/DOWN SEQ Hole standing full. Long stroke pump to 1200 #psi in 4 stroke's good pump action. RU pumping

PUMPING UNIT unit & adjust 16" tag. Check unÌt. Good
13:30 15:00 1.50 RIG UP/DOWN LOC Rig down & clean up location, Turn well over to production. Shut down to repair rig
15:00 16:00 1,00 DRIVE TOlFROM TRAV Crew travel to town

LOCATION
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RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/8/2014 06:00 - 5/9/2014 06:00
QEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report#8

API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Configuration Type
43-047-33954 S17-T8S-R21E GYPSUM HILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Unique WellID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KB to CF (ft) Spad Date Final Dríg Rig Release Total Depth (All) (ft, KB)

UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 1012912001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE -7,850.0

Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Date
AFE - REC (completion) STlMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RlG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) Daily FFeld Est Total (Cost) Cum Field Est To Date (Cost)
REC-00085 21,774.60 428,224.78
Operations at Report Time Remarks
SICP=0, SITP=0
Operations Summary
5/8/14: SICP=0, SITP=D, Stand polish rod back. Continued to pick up RIH with remaining rod string. Space out & seat rod pump. Long stroke pump to 1200
#psi in 4 stroke's. Good pump action. RU unit & adjust 16" off tag. Check unit. RDMOturn well over to production
Daily Readings
Weather Temperature (°F) Road Condition Tubtng Pressure (psi) Castng Pressure (psi) Rig Time (hr)
C ear 46.0 Dry 0.0 0.0
Daily Contacts

Job Contact . .
- Title Mobile -

Tom Jones Supervisor 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell . Tool Pusher 435 828 7848

Time Log
Start Time End Time Our (hr) Activity: Code ..

. Com
06:00 07:00 1.00 DRIVE TO/FROM TRAV 5/8/14: Grew travelto location

LOCATION
07:00 07:30 0.50 SAFETY MEETING RIG Safety meeting. Check SICP=0, SITP=0 Open well up
07:30 12:00 4.50 RUN/PULL PUMP TRP Stand polish Tod back. Continued to pick up & RIH with 67- 3/4" Plain rod's, 84- 7/8" plain rod's,

1- 8',6',4' x 7/8" pony sub's. 1 1/2" x 26' polish rod. Seat rod pump.
12:00 13:30 1.50 RiG UP/DOWN SEQ Hole standing full. Long stroke pump to 1200 #psi in 4 stroke's good pump action. RU pumping

PUMPING UNIT unit & adjust 16" tag. Check unÌt. Good
13:30 15:00 1.50 RIG UP/DOWN LOC Rig down & clean up location, Turn well over to production. Shut down to repair rig
15:00 16:00 1,00 DRIVE TOlFROM TRAV Crew travel to town

LOCATION
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RECEIVED: Oct. 27, 2014

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/9/2014 06:00 - 5/10/2014 06:00
OEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report#9

API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Coniiguration Type
43-047-33954 S17-T8S-R21E GYPSUM HILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
LFnique well ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KB to CF (ft) Spud Date Final Orig Rig Release Total Oepth (AII) (ft KB)

UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINALHOLE -7,850.0

Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Date

AFE - REC (completion) STIMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RIG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) Daily Field Est Total (Cost) Cum Field Est To Oste (Cost)
REC-00085 21,229.83 449,454.61
Operations at Report Time Remarks

Operations Summary
LABOR .

Daily Readings
Weather Temperature ("F) Road Condttlan Tubing Pressure (psi) Casing Pressure (psi) Rig Time (hr)

Dy
Daily Contacts

Job Contact Title ,- Mobile
Tom Jones Supervisor 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell Tool Pusher 435 828 7848

Timò Log
Start Time End Time Our (hr) Activity Code Com

QEP Energy Company Page 1/1 Report Printed: 10/27/2014

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/9/2014 06:00 - 5/10/2014 06:00
OEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report#9

API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Coniiguration Type
43-047-33954 S17-T8S-R21E GYPSUM HILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
LFnique well ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KB to CF (ft) Spud Date Final Orig Rig Release Total Oepth (AII) (ft KB)

UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINALHOLE -7,850.0

Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Date

AFE - REC (completion) STIMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RIG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) Daily Field Est Total (Cost) Cum Field Est To Oste (Cost)
REC-00085 21,229.83 449,454.61
Operations at Report Time Remarks

Operations Summary
LABOR .

Daily Readings
Weather Temperature ("F) Road Condttlan Tubing Pressure (psi) Casing Pressure (psi) Rig Time (hr)

Dy
Daily Contacts

Job Contact Title ,- Mobile
Tom Jones Supervisor 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell Tool Pusher 435 828 7848

Timò Log
Start Time End Time Our (hr) Activity Code Com

QEP Energy Company Page 1/1 Report Printed: 10/27/2014

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/9/2014 06:00 - 5/10/2014 06:00
OEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report#9

API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Coniiguration Type
43-047-33954 S17-T8S-R21E GYPSUM HILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
LFnique well ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KB to CF (ft) Spud Date Final Orig Rig Release Total Oepth (AII) (ft KB)

UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINALHOLE -7,850.0

Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Date

AFE - REC (completion) STIMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RIG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) Daily Field Est Total (Cost) Cum Field Est To Oste (Cost)
REC-00085 21,229.83 449,454.61
Operations at Report Time Remarks

Operations Summary
LABOR .

Daily Readings
Weather Temperature ("F) Road Condttlan Tubing Pressure (psi) Casing Pressure (psi) Rig Time (hr)

Dy
Daily Contacts

Job Contact Title ,- Mobile
Tom Jones Supervisor 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell Tool Pusher 435 828 7848

Timò Log
Start Time End Time Our (hr) Activity Code Com
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RECEIVED: Oct. 27, 2014

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/14/2014 06:00 - 5/15/2014 06:00
QEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report#10
API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Configuration Type
43-047-33954 S17-T8S-R21E GYPSUM HILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Unique Well ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Eievation KB to CF (ft) Spad Date Final Drlg Rig Release Total Depth (AII)(ft, KB)
UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE -7,850.0

Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Date
AFE - REC (completion) STIMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RIG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) Daily Reld Est Total (Cost) Cum Field EstTo Date (Cost)
REC-00085 131,891.38 581,345.99
Operations at Report Time Remarks

Operations Summary
HOOK UP TREATER . INSULATE TANKS . HOOK UP COMPRESSOR
Daily Readings
Westiler Temperature ( F) Road Candillon Tubing Pressure (psi) Casing Pressure (psi) Rig Time (hr)

Dry
Daily Contacts

Job Contact . .Title
.

Mobile
Tom Jones Supervisar 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell Tool Pusher , : . 435 828 7848 :

Time.Log
Start Tíme End Time . Dur (hr) Aclvity Code . Com

QEP Energy Company Page 1/1 Report Printed: 10/27/2014

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/14/2014 06:00 - 5/15/2014 06:00
QEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report#10
API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Configuration Type
43-047-33954 S17-T8S-R21E GYPSUM HILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Unique Well ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Eievation KB to CF (ft) Spad Date Final Drlg Rig Release Total Depth (AII)(ft, KB)
UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE -7,850.0

Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Date
AFE - REC (completion) STIMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RIG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) Daily Reld Est Total (Cost) Cum Field EstTo Date (Cost)
REC-00085 131,891.38 581,345.99
Operations at Report Time Remarks

Operations Summary
HOOK UP TREATER . INSULATE TANKS . HOOK UP COMPRESSOR
Daily Readings
Westiler Temperature ( F) Road Candillon Tubing Pressure (psi) Casing Pressure (psi) Rig Time (hr)

Dry
Daily Contacts

Job Contact . .Title
.

Mobile
Tom Jones Supervisar 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell Tool Pusher , : . 435 828 7848 :

Time.Log
Start Tíme End Time . Dur (hr) Aclvity Code . Com
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RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/14/2014 06:00 - 5/15/2014 06:00
QEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report#10
API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Configuration Type
43-047-33954 S17-T8S-R21E GYPSUM HILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Unique Well ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Eievation KB to CF (ft) Spad Date Final Drlg Rig Release Total Depth (AII)(ft, KB)
UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE -7,850.0

Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Date
AFE - REC (completion) STIMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose RIG
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cost) Daily Reld Est Total (Cost) Cum Field EstTo Date (Cost)
REC-00085 131,891.38 581,345.99
Operations at Report Time Remarks

Operations Summary
HOOK UP TREATER . INSULATE TANKS . HOOK UP COMPRESSOR
Daily Readings
Westiler Temperature ( F) Road Candillon Tubing Pressure (psi) Casing Pressure (psi) Rig Time (hr)

Dry
Daily Contacts

Job Contact . .Title
.

Mobile
Tom Jones Supervisar 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell Tool Pusher , : . 435 828 7848 :

Time.Log
Start Tíme End Time . Dur (hr) Aclvity Code . Com
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RECEIVED: Oct. 27, 2014

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/15/2014 06:00 - 5/16/2014 06:00
QEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report#11

API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Configuration Type
43-047-33954 S17-T8S-R21E GYPSUMHILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Unique Well 10 Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KBtoCF (ft) Spad Date Final Dr1gRig Release Total Depth (All) (ft, KB)
UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE -7,850.0
Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Date
AFE , REC (completion) STIMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose R1G
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cosi) DailyField Est Total (Cost) Cum Field Est TO Date (Cost)
REC-0DOB5 56,946.60 638,292.59
Operations at Report Time RemaTks

Operations Summary

WATER TANK. MOVE TREATER . SET 100 BBL TANK .

Dal[y Readings
Weather Temperature ('F) Road Condition Tublag PressuEe (ps[) Casing Pressure (psi) RigTime (hr)

Dry
Daily Contacts

: Job Contact .11tle Mobile
Tom Jones Supervisor 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell

.
Tool Pusher

.
435 828 7848

Timè Log
Starl Time End Time .. DUr (hr) . Activity Code . - Com
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RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/15/2014 06:00 - 5/16/2014 06:00
QEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report#11

API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Configuration Type
43-047-33954 S17-T8S-R21E GYPSUMHILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Unique Well 10 Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KBtoCF (ft) Spad Date Final Dr1gRig Release Total Depth (All) (ft, KB)
UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE -7,850.0
Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Date
AFE , REC (completion) STIMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose R1G
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cosi) DailyField Est Total (Cost) Cum Field Est TO Date (Cost)
REC-0DOB5 56,946.60 638,292.59
Operations at Report Time RemaTks

Operations Summary

WATER TANK. MOVE TREATER . SET 100 BBL TANK .

Dal[y Readings
Weather Temperature ('F) Road Condition Tublag PressuEe (ps[) Casing Pressure (psi) RigTime (hr)

Dry
Daily Contacts

: Job Contact .11tle Mobile
Tom Jones Supervisor 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell

.
Tool Pusher

.
435 828 7848

Timè Log
Starl Time End Time .. DUr (hr) . Activity Code . - Com

QEP Energy Company Page 111 Report Printed: 10/27/2014

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,

Sundry Number: 57022 API Well Number: 43047339540000

QEP Daily Workover Report

5/15/2014 06:00 - 5/16/2014 06:00
QEP Energy Company

Well Name: WV 5W-17-8-21 Report#11

API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Configuration Type
43-047-33954 S17-T8S-R21E GYPSUMHILLS UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Unique Well 10 Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KBtoCF (ft) Spad Date Final Dr1gRig Release Total Depth (All) (ft, KB)
UT102700 4,688 4,703.00, <elvothernote> 15.00 10/3/2001 00:00 10/29/2001 12:00 ORIGINAL HOLE -7,850.0
Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Start Date Job End Date
AFE , REC (completion) STIMULATION 4/17/2014 5/16/2014
Purpose R1G
Production enhancement 5
AFE Number Job AFE + Supp Amount (Cosi) DailyField Est Total (Cost) Cum Field Est TO Date (Cost)
REC-0DOB5 56,946.60 638,292.59
Operations at Report Time RemaTks

Operations Summary

WATER TANK. MOVE TREATER . SET 100 BBL TANK .

Dal[y Readings
Weather Temperature ('F) Road Condition Tublag PressuEe (ps[) Casing Pressure (psi) RigTime (hr)

Dry
Daily Contacts

: Job Contact .11tle Mobile
Tom Jones Supervisor 435 823 5400
Baxter Powell

.
Tool Pusher

.
435 828 7848

Timè Log
Starl Time End Time .. DUr (hr) . Activity Code . - Com

QEP Energy Company Page 111 Report Printed: 10/27/2014

RECEIVED: Oct. 27,
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