
PERIITC0
MPA

14421 County Road 10 • Fort Lupton, Colorado 80621 • (303)857-9999 • FAX(303) 857-0577 • E-MAll.LSPermitco@aol.com

August2, 2000

DivisionofOil,Gas&Mining
1594WestNorthTemple,Suite1210
Box 145801
SaltLakeCity,UT 84114-5801

Attn:MikeHebertson
Re: GilmanA.Hill

Federal#31-29
682'FNLand2042'FEL
NWNESec 20,TOS-R19E
UintahCounty,Utah

DearMike,

Enclosed pleasefindthreecopiesoftheApplicationfor Permitto Drill,alongwithonecopyofthe
OnshoreOrderNo,1whichhas been submittedtothe SûreauofLandManagementirtvernal,Stahonthisdate.

Ifyoushouldneedadditionalinformation,pleasedon't besitatetocontactme. AbþrovädGöpiesofthe
A.P.D.shouldbesentto Permitco Inc.ht theaddressshownabove.

Sincerely,

ConsultantforGilmanA.Will

Enc.

Cc: GilmanA.Hill- Englewood,CO
PannonianEnergy,Inc.- Englewood,CO

RECEIVED
AUG2 12000
DIVISIONOF

OIL,GAS AND
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MPA
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O
Form 3160-3 FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) OMB No. 1004-0136

UNITED STATES Expires November 30, 2000
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. Lease Serial No.

BEREAL OFLAND MANAGEMENT UTU-76262

APPLICATIONFORPERMITTODRILLORREENTER
6. If Indian, Allotteeor Tribe Name

N/A
la. Type of Work: DRILL REEN'IER 7. If Unit or CA Agreement,Name and No.

N/A
8. Lease Name and Well No.

b. Type of Well: Oil WeH Gas Well O othar Ð sinal - O Multiple Zone Federal
2. Nameof operator 303/771-1101 7128 S. PoplarLane 9. API Well No.

GilmanA.Hill Englewood,CO80112 #31-29 '
3A. Address 303/857-9999 14421 CountyRoad 10 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

PERMITC0lNC. FortLupton,CO8068 CEIVED - As
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requir .n . 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk, and Surveyor Area

At surface 682' FNLand2042'FEL Sec. 29, T9S-R19E
At proposed prod. Zone NWNESec. 29 T9S-R19E
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office*

DIVISION OF 12. County or Pansh 13. State

26 milessoutheastofMyton,UT OIL, GAS AND MINING Uintah UT
1.1 Distance from proposed* 16. No. of Acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit ded cated to this welllocation to nearest

property or lease line, ft.
(Also to nearest drig. unit line.if any)

595' 900.18 40
18. Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on fileto nearest well, drilline. Completed,

applied for, on this leale, ft.

None 12,385' 019$103157173
21. EÌevalions(Show whether DE, KDB, RT, GL etc3 22. Approximate date work will start* 23. Estimatedduration

4823' GL Sept 1,2000 20 days
24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requiremetus of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Rond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see

2. A Drilling Plan- Item 20 above).

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands. the i Operator certification.
SI PO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office. 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the

authorized office.

25. Signature ..- Name (Printed/Tiped) Date

fitte
fd LisaL.Smith 08/17/2000

AutholizedAgentforGilmanA.Hill gg
Approved by (Signature) a e ' (gg Date

Gil.Gas ¢ Mining
Title g)ffk ,

Date:
Application approval does not warrant or eenify that the applicant hol al of t lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct

operations thereon.

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached.

Title 18 E.S.C. Section 1001and Title -‡3 U.S.C. Section 1212. make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the United
States any false,fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.
*(Instructions on reverse)

FederalApprovalof thIs
ActIon Is Necessary

O
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GIUMAN A. HILL
T9S, Rí9E, S.L.B.&M. Well location. FEDERAL #31--29, located

as shown in the NW 1/4 NE 1/4 of Section
29, T9S, RT9E, S.L.B.&M., Uintah County,NB959'W - GLO. (Basis of Bearings) Utah.SB9'57'52"W 26]Z87' (Meas.) 2637 15' - (Measured)

BASIS OF ELEVATION1910 Brass Cy 19/0 Brass Cap 4 1910 Brass Cap
f.J' Hy, Pie I.f' Hg, PRe \¾ 1.4' Heph, PRe
orstmes orstones % o. | orstones SPOT ELEVATIONLOCATED AT THE NORTHWEST CORNERto OF SECTION 29, T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM

2042' THE UTELAND BUTTE, QUADRANGLE,UTAH, UINTAHFEDERAL/31-29
COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTE SERIES (TOPOGRAPHICAL MAP)Elev. Ungraded Ground =

4823, (comp.) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF
THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL SURVEY. SAID ELEVATION
IS MARKED AS BEING 4771 FEET.

I

N
o

4/ o o oo O - o

SCALE

CERTiFICATE
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE PLAT P g'9 FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MADE B Mg,0R UNDE
SUPERVISION AND THAT THE SAME ARE TÀUE, ND CORRECT'
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND B

REGISTE Ð LAÑD SUÀ #R
REGISTRATIONNÓ 161319
STATE OF U .

UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND
EAST - 80,00 (G.L.O.) 85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078

LEGEND: (435) 769-1017

SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAwN:=
90° SYMBOL LATITUDE =

40°00'26" 1" = 1000' 06-29-00 07--25-00
0 PARTY REFERENCES= PROPOSED WELL HEAD· LONGITUDE =

109°48'06"
G.S. C.T. D.R.B. G,L.O. PLATÁ = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. WEATHER FILE

WARM GILLMAN A.
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APPLICATIONFORPERMITTODRIL REENTER

24. Attachments
The following,completedinaccordancewiththe requirementsofOnshoreOiland GasOrderNo.1, shallbe attachedtothisform:

1. Wellplatcertifiedbya registeredsurvey.
ATTACHED

2. ADrillingPlan
GilmanA. Hillproposes todrilla well toa depth of 12,385' totest theMesaVede formation. If productive,casingwillbe run and thewell
completed.Ifdry, thewellwillbe plugged andabandonedas perBLMandstate of Utahrequirements. See Onshore Order No.1
attached.

3. ASurfaceUse Plan(ifthelocationis on NationalForestSystemLands,theSUPOshallbe filedwiththeAppropriateForestServiceOffice.
N/A

4. Bondtocovertheoperationsunlesscoveredbyan existing bondon file(see Item20).
Bondcoveragefor thiswell is providedby GilmanA. HillundertheirStatewide Bond No.019S103157173.The principalis
GilmanA. Hill viasuretyconsentas provided for in 43 CFR3104.2.

5. Operatorcertification.
Please be advisedthatGilmanA. Hillis consideredto be the Operator oftheabovementionedwell. GilmanA. Hill
agrees tobe responsibleunderthe termsandconditionsof thelease for theoperationsconductedupontheleased lands.

6. Suchothersite specificinformationand/orplansas maybe requiredbytheauthorizedofficer.

RECEIVED
AUG2 1 2000
DIVISION OF

OIL, GAS AND
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CONFIDENTIAL- TIGHTHOLE

ONSHOREOIL&GASORDERNO.1

ApprovalofOperations onOnshore
FederalandIndianOil&Gas Leases

FEDERAL#31-29
682' FNLand 2042'FEL

NWNESec.29,T9S- R19E
UintahCounty, Utah

Prepared For:

GILMANA.HILL

By:

PERMITCOINC.
14421County Road 10

Ft. Lupton,Colorado 80621
303/857-9999 o

Copies Sent To:

3 - Bureau of LandManagement- Vernal,UT
1 - UtahDivisionofOil,Gas &Mining- SLC,UT
1-GilmanA.Hill-Englewood,CO RECElt'ED / 42 - Pannonian Energy,Inc. - Englewood,CO . ,1 - Energy Operating - Lakewood,CO gig ; ggg PElkIITC0

DIVISION OF coagp¢OIL, GAS AND
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O O
GILLMAN A. HILL

FEDERAL #31-29
LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

SECTION 29, T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M.

PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #7 TO LOCATION STAKE CAMERA ANGLE: SOUTHEASTERLY

PHOTO: VIEW FROM BEGINNING OF PROPOSED ACCESS CAMERA ANGLE: EASTERLY

Z LOCATIONPHOTos 7 28 00 moro
85 South 200 East Vemal, Utah 84078 * =

- Since 1964 435-789-1017 uels@uelsine com TAKENBYG,S DRAWNBYC.G. REVISED:
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ONSHOREOIL&GASORDERNO.1
ApprovalofOperationsonOnshore

FederalandIndianOilandGas Leases

Allleaseand/orunitoperationswillbeconductedinsuchamannerthatfullcomplianceismadewithapplicable
laws,regulations(43CFR 3100),OnshoreOilandGas OrderNo.1,andtheapprovedplanofoperations.The
operatorisfullyresponsiblefortheactionsofhissubcontractors.Acopyoftheseconditionswillbe furnished
thefieldrepresentativeto insurecompliance.

1. ESTIMATEDTOPSOFIMPORTANTGEOLOGICMARKERS

Formation Depth Subsea

Uintah Surface 4,840'

Green River 1,805' 3,050'

Wasatch 5,375' -520'

Mesaverde 8,885 -4,030'

MancosShale 12,285' -7,430'

T.D. 12,385' -7,530'

I

2. ESTIMATEDDEPTHOFANTICIPATEDWATER,OIL,GASORMINERALFORMATIONS:
I

Substance Formation Depth

Gas Wasatch 5,875-8,385'

Gas Mesaverde 8,885-12,285'

Coal,MinorErratic Mesaverde 10,000-12,285'
II

Allfresh waterprospectivelyvaluablemineralsencounteredduringdrilling,willbe recorded
by depth and adequatelyprotected. Alloiland gas showswillbe testedto determine
commercialpotential.

OIL, GAS AND M NING

ONSHOREORDERNO.1 ONFIDENTIAL- TIGHTHOLE
GilmanA.Hill
Federal #31-29 Lease No.UTU-76262
682' FNLand2042'FEL
NWNESec. 29,T9S - R19E DRILLINGPROGRAM
UintahCounty,Utah Page 1

ONSHOREOIL&GASORDERNO.1
ApprovalofOperationsonOnshore

FederalandIndianOilandGas Leases

Allleaseand/orunitoperationswillbeconductedinsuchamannerthatfullcomplianceismadewithapplicable
laws,regulations(43CFR 3100),OnshoreOilandGas OrderNo.1,andtheapprovedplanofoperations.The
operatorisfullyresponsiblefortheactionsofhissubcontractors.Acopyoftheseconditionswillbe furnished
thefieldrepresentativeto insurecompliance.

1. ESTIMATEDTOPSOFIMPORTANTGEOLOGICMARKERS

Formation Depth Subsea

Uintah Surface 4,840'

Green River 1,805' 3,050'

Wasatch 5,375' -520'

Mesaverde 8,885 -4,030'

MancosShale 12,285' -7,430'

T.D. 12,385' -7,530'

I

2. ESTIMATEDDEPTHOFANTICIPATEDWATER,OIL,GASORMINERALFORMATIONS:
I

Substance Formation Depth

Gas Wasatch 5,875-8,385'

Gas Mesaverde 8,885-12,285'

Coal,MinorErratic Mesaverde 10,000-12,285'
II

Allfresh waterprospectivelyvaluablemineralsencounteredduringdrilling,willbe recorded
by depth and adequatelyprotected. Alloiland gas showswillbe testedto determine
commercialpotential.

OIL, GAS AND M NING

ONSHOREORDERNO.1 ONFIDENTIAL- TIGHTHOLE
GilmanA.Hill
Federal #31-29 Lease No.UTU-76262
682' FNLand2042'FEL
NWNESec. 29,T9S - R19E DRILLINGPROGRAM
UintahCounty,Utah Page 1

ONSHOREOIL&GASORDERNO.1
ApprovalofOperationsonOnshore

FederalandIndianOilandGas Leases

Allleaseand/orunitoperationswillbeconductedinsuchamannerthatfullcomplianceismadewithapplicable
laws,regulations(43CFR 3100),OnshoreOilandGas OrderNo.1,andtheapprovedplanofoperations.The
operatorisfullyresponsiblefortheactionsofhissubcontractors.Acopyoftheseconditionswillbe furnished
thefieldrepresentativeto insurecompliance.

1. ESTIMATEDTOPSOFIMPORTANTGEOLOGICMARKERS

Formation Depth Subsea

Uintah Surface 4,840'

Green River 1,805' 3,050'

Wasatch 5,375' -520'

Mesaverde 8,885 -4,030'

MancosShale 12,285' -7,430'

T.D. 12,385' -7,530'

I

2. ESTIMATEDDEPTHOFANTICIPATEDWATER,OIL,GASORMINERALFORMATIONS:
I

Substance Formation Depth

Gas Wasatch 5,875-8,385'

Gas Mesaverde 8,885-12,285'

Coal,MinorErratic Mesaverde 10,000-12,285'
II

Allfresh waterprospectivelyvaluablemineralsencounteredduringdrilling,willbe recorded
by depth and adequatelyprotected. Alloiland gas showswillbe testedto determine
commercialpotential.

OIL, GAS AND M NING



ONSHOREORDERNO.1 $ NFIDENTIAL- TlGHTHOLE
GilmanA.Hill
Federal #31-29 Lease No.UTU-76262
682' FNLand2042' FEL
NWNESec. 29, T9S - Ri9E DRILLINGPROGRAM
UintahCounty,Utah Page 2

3. PRESSURECONTROLEQUIPMENT

GilmanA.Hill'sminimumspecificationsforpressurecontrolequipmentareasfollows:

RamType: 11" Hydraulicdoublewithannular,5000 psiw.p.

Ramtypepreventersandassociatedequipmentshallbe testedtoapprovedstackworkingpressure
if isolatedby testplugor to 70 percent of internalyield pressure ofcasing.Pressureshallbe
maintainedforat least 10 minutesoruntilrequirementsoftestaremet,whicheveris longer.Ifa test
plugis utilized,nobleed-offpressure isacceptable.Fora testnotutilizinga testplug,ifa declinein
pressureofmorethan10percentin30 minutesoccurs,thetestshallbe consideredtohavefailed.
Valveoncasinghead belowtestplugshallbe openduringtestofBOPstack.

Annulartypepreventers(ifused)shallbe testedto50 percentofratedworkingpressure. Pressure
shallbe maintainedat least 10 minutesoruntilprovisionsoftestaremet,whicheveris longer.

As a minimum,the abovetestshallbe pedormed:

a. wheninitiallyinstalled;
b. wheneveranysealsubjecttotestpressure is broken
c. followingrelatedrepairs;and
d. at 30-dayintemals

Valvesshallbe testedfromworkingpressure sideduringBOPEtestswithalldownstreamvalves
open.

Whentestingthe killlinevalve(s) the checkvalveshallbe heldopenortheballremoved.

Annularpreventersshallbe functionallyoperatedat leastweekly.

Pipeandblindramsshallbe activatedeachtrip,however,thisfunctionneednotbe performedmore
thanoncea day.

ABOPEpitleveldrillshallbe conductedweeklyforeachdrillingcrew.

Pressuretestsshallapplytoall relatedwellcontrolequipment.

Alloftheabovedescribedtests and/ordrillsshallbe recordedinthedrillinglog.
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BOPsystemsshallbe consistentwithAPIRP53. Pressuretestswillbe conductedbeforedrillingout
fromundercasingstringswhichhave been set andcementedinplace. Blowoutpreventercontrols
willbeinstalledpriortodrillingthesurfacecasingplugandwillremaininuseuntilthewelliscompleted
orabandoned.Preventerswillbe inspectedandoperatedat leastdailytoensuregoodmechanical
workingorder,andthisinspectionwillbe recordedonthedailydrillingreport.Preventerswillbe
pressuretestedbeforedrillingcasingcementplugs.

TheDistrictOfficeshouldbenotified,withsufficientleadtime,inordertohavetheBLMrepresentative
on locationduringpressuretesting.

a. ThesizeandratingoftheBOPstackisshownontheattacheddiagram.Althougha righas
notbeen chosentodrillthiswell,mostofthe equipmentforthisdepthofholeintheareause
a 11",5000psiworkingpressure blowoutpreventor,

b. Achokelineanda killlinearetobe properlyinstalled. The killlineis ng tobe used as a
fill-upline.

c. Theaccumulatorsystemshallhavea pressurecapacitytoprovideforrepeatedoperationof
hydraulicpreventers,

d. Drillstringsafetyvalve(s),tofitalltoolsinthedrillstring,aretobe maintainedontherigfloor
whiledrillingoperationsare inprogress.

4. PROPOSEDCASINGANDCEMENTINGPROGRAM:

a. The proposedcasingandcementingprogramshallbe conductedas approvedto protect
and/orisolateallusablewaterzones, potentiallyproductivezones,lostcirculationzones,
abnormallypressured zones, and anyprospectivelyvaluabledepositsofminerals.Any
isolatingmediumotherthancementshallreceiveapprovalpriortouse. Thecasingsetting
depthshallbe calculatedtopositionthecasingseatoppositea competentformationwhich
willcontainthe maximumpressure to which it willbe exposedduringnormaldrilling
operations. Determinationof casingsettingdepth shallbe based on allrelevantfactors,
including;presencelabsence of hydrocarbons;fracture gradients;usablewater zones;
formationpressures; lostcirculationzones;otherminerals;orotherunusualcharacteristics.
Allindicationsofusablewatershallbe reported.
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b. Casing design shallassumeformationpressure gradientsof0.44 to0.50 psi perfootfor
exploratorywells(lackingbetterdata).

c. Casingdesignshallassumefracturegradientsfrom0.70to 1.00psiperfootforexploratory
wells(lackingbetterdata)

d. Casingcollarsshallhavea minimumclearanceof0.422inchesofallsidesinthehole/casing
annulus,withrecognitionthatvariancescanbe grantedforjustifiedexceptions.

e. Allwaitingoncementtimesshallbe adequatetoachievea minimumof500psicompressive
strengthatthecasingshoepriortodrillingout.

f. Allcasingexcepttheconductorcasing,shallbe neworreconditionedandtestedusedcasing
thatmeets orexceedsAPIstandardsfornewcasing.

g. Thesurfacecasingshallbe cementedbacktosurfaceeitherduringtheprimarycementjob
orbyremedialcementing.

h. Allindicationsofusablewatershallbe reportedtotheauthorizedofficerpriortorunningthe
nextstringofcasingorbeforepluggingordersarerequested,whicheveroccursfirst.

i. Threecentralizerswillbe runonthebottomthreejointsofsurfacecasingwitha minimumof
onecentralizerperjointstartingwiththe shoejoint.

j. Topplugsshallbe used toreducecontaminationofcementbydisplacementfluid.Abottom
plugorother acceptable technique,suchas a suitablepreflushfluid,innerstringcement
method,etc.shallbe utilizedtohelpisolatethecementfromcontaminationbythemudfluid
beingdisplacedaheadofthecementslurnj.

k. Allcasingstringsbelowtheconductorshallbe pressuretestedto0.22psiperfootofcasing
stringlengthor1500 psi,whicheverisgreater,but nottoexceed70 percentoftheminimum
intemalyield.Ifpressuredeclinesmorethan10percentin30minutes,correctiveactionshall
be taken,

l. Onallexploratorywells,andonthatportionofanywellapprovedfora 5MBOPEsystemor
greater,a pressure integritytest ofeachcasingshoeshallbe performed.Formationatthe
shoeshallbe testedtoa minimumofthemudweightequivalentanticipatedtocontrolthe
formationpressure to the nextcasing depthorat totaldepthofthewell. Thistestshallbe
performedbeforedrillingmorethan20 feetofnewhole.

PERilITC0DMSION OF
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m. Theproposedcasingprogramwillbe as follows:

. I. . . I I

Purpose Depth HoleSize 0.D. Weight Grade Type New/Used

Conductor 0-200' 17-1/2" 13-3/8" 48# H-40 ST&C New

Surface 0-3500' 12-1/4" 9-5/8" 36# K-55 LT&C New

Production 0- 2000' 8-3/4" 5-1/2" 20# N-80 LT&C New

Production 2000-8700' 8-3/4" 5-1/2" 17# N-80 LT&C New

Production 8700-12,385' 8-3/4" 5-1/2" 20# N-80 LT&C New

n. Casingdesignsubjectto revisionbased ongeologicconditionsencountered.

o. Thecementprogramwillbe as follows:

Surface TypeandAmount

0-3500' 1000sx Lightcementplus2%CaCl2plus il4#lsk cellophane
flakefollowedby150sxClass"G"with2%CaCl2and1/4
#lsk cellophaneflakeorsufficienttocirculatetosurface.

Production TypeandAmount

12,385-8,000' +/- 1000sxClass "G"withadditivestobe determined.Note:
Stage Cementingtoolmaybe rundependingonproductive
intervals.

p. Anticipatedcementtopswillbe reportedas todepth;nottheexpectednumberofsacksof
cementtobe used. TheDistrictOfficeshouldbe notified,withsufficientleadtime,inorderto
havea BLMrepresentativeon locationwhilerunningallcasingstringsandcementing.

q. Aftercementingbutbeforecommencinganytest,thecasingstringshallstandcementeduntil
thecementhas reacheda compressivestrengthofat least500psiattheshoe. WOCtime
shallbe recordedinthedriller'slog.
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r. Thefollowingreportsshallbe filedwiththeDistrictManagerwithin30days aftertheworkis
completed.

1. Progress reports,Form3160-5(formerly9-331)"SundryNoticesandReportson
Wells",mustincludecompleteinformationconcerning:

a. Settingofeach stringofcasing, showingthesize,grade,weightofcasing
set, holesize,settingdepth,amountsandtypeofcementused,whether
cementcirculatedor the topof thecementbehindthe casing,depth of
cementingtoolsused, casingtestmethodandresults,andthedate work
wasdone. Showthespuddate onthefirstreportssubmitted.

b. Temperatureorbondlogsmustbe submittedforeachwellwherethecasing
cementwas notcirculatedtothesurface.

s. Auxiliaryequipmenttobe usedisas follows:

1. Kellycock

2. Nobitfloatisdeemednecessary.

3. Asubwithafullopeningvalve.

5. MUDPROGRAM

a. Theproposedcirculatingmediumstobe employedindrillingareasfollows:

Il

Interval MudType MudWt. Visc. FIL PH
I I I

0-3500' FreshWater 8.3-8.5 35 N/C 9.0

3500'-8885' KCLBrine 8.5-8.7 35 10-12cc 9.0
8885-T.D. KCLBrine/Polymer 9.0-10.0 35-55 <10 cc's 9.0

I I

Therewillbe sufficientmudonlocationtocontrola blowoutshouldoneoccur.
Amudtestshallbe performedevery24 hoursaftermuddinguptodetermine,as applicable:
density,viscosity,gelstrength,staticfiltrationI and y og

PERilITC0
DMSION OF
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b. Mudmonitoringequipmenttobe used isas follows:

1. Periodiccheckswillbe madeeach tourofthe mudsystem.Themudlevelwillbe
checkedvisually,

c. Nochromateadditiveswillbe used inthemudsystemonFederaland/orIndianlandswithout
priorBLMapprovaltoensureadequateprotectionoffreshwateraquifers.

d. NochemicalssubjecttoreportingunderSARATitlelllinanamountequaltoorgreaterthan
10,000 pounds willbe used, produced,stored,transported,or disposed ofannuallyin
associationwiththedrillingofthiswell. Furthermore,noextremelyhazardoussubstances,
as definedin40 CFR355, inthresholdplanningquantities,willbe used,produced,stored,
transported,ordisposedofinassociationwiththedrillingofthiswell.

e. TheuseofmaterialsunderBLMjurisdictionwillconformto43 CFR3610.2-3.

6. EVALUATIONPROGRAM

Theanticipatedtypeandamountoftesting,loggingandcoringareas follows:

a. Nodrillstemtestsareanticipated,however,ifDST'sarerun,thefollowingrequirementswill
be adheredto:

lnitialopeningofdrillstemtest toolsshallbe restrictedto daylighthours unlessspecific
approvaltostartduringotherhoursisobtainedfromtheauthorizedofficer.However,DST's
maybe allowedtocontinueatnightifthetestwas initiatedduringdaylighthoursandtherate
of flowis stabilizedand ifadequatelightingis available(i.e.lightingwhich is adequatefor
visibilityandvapor-proofforsafeoperations).Packerscanbe released,buttrippingshallnot
beginbeforedaylight,unlesspriorapprovalisobtainedfromtheauthorizedofficer.Closed
chamberDSTsmaybe accomplisheddayornight.

ADSTthatflowstothesurfacewithevidenceofhydrocarbonsshallbe eitherreversedout
ofthetestingstringundercontrolledsurfaceconditions.Thiswouldinvolveprovidedsome
meansforreversecirculation.
Separationequipmentrequiredfortheanticipatedrecoveryshallbe properlyinstalledbefore
a test
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Allengineswithin100feetofthewellborethatare requiredto"run"duringthetestshallhavespark
arrestersorwatercooledexhausts,

b. AnAzimuthalLaterlog-GR-Cal-SPaswellasa Litho-Density-CompensatedNeutron(mabe)
andBoreholeCompensatedSonic(mabe)willbe runfromT.D.tobase ofsurfacecasing,

c. Nocoresareanticipated,

d. Whether the well is completedas a dry hole or as a producer,"WellCompletionand
RecompletionReportandLog"(Form3160-4)willbe submittednotlaterthan30daysafter
completionofthewelloraftercompletionofoperationsbeingperformed,inaccordancewith
43 CFR 3164. Twocopiesofalllogs, coredescriptions,coreanalyses,well-testdata,
geologicsummaries,sampledescription,andallothersurveysordataobtainedandcompiled
duringthedrilling,workover,and/orcompletionoperations,willbe filedwithform3160-4.
Samples(cutting,fluids,and/orgases0 willbe submittedwhenrequestedbytheauthorized
officer(AO).

e. Theanticipatedcompletionprogramwillbe to test prospectivezonesintheWasatchand
MesaVerde,pedorate,fracand/oracidizeas necessaryandplaceonproduction.

f. Dailydrillingandcompletionprogress reportsshallbe submittedtotheBLMinVernalona
weeklybasis.

7. ABNORMALTEMPERATURESORPRESSURES

a. Theexpectedbottomholepressure is6800psi.

b. Nohydrogensulfidegas is anticipatedand no abnormalpressures or temperaturesare
anticipated.

8. ANTICIPATEDSTARTINGDATESANDNOTIFICATIONOFOPERATIONS

a. Drillingwillcommenceimmediatelyuponapprovalofthisapplication,due toa pendingfarm
outexpirationonOctober1, 2000,

b. Itisanticipatedthatthedrillingofthiswellwilltakeapproximately20days.

OIL, CAS AND M NG
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c. The BLMin Vernal,Utah shall be notifiedof anticipateddate of locationconstruction
commencementandofanticipatedspuddate.

d. Nolocationwillbe constructedormoved,nowellwillbe plugged,andnodrillingorworkover
equipmentwillbe removedfroma wellto be placed ina suspendedstatuswithoutprior
approvalofthe AO. Ifoperationsare to be suspended,priorapprovaloftheAOwillbe
obtainedandnotificationgivenbeforeresumptionofoperations.

e. Thespuddatewillbe reportedorallytotheAOwithin48hoursafterspudding.Ifthespudding
occursona weekendorholiday,thereportwillbe submittedonthefollowingregularwork
day. Theoralreportwillbe followedupwitha SundryNotice.

f. InaccordancewithOnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1,thiswellwillbe reportedonForm3160-
6 "MonthlyReportofOperations",startingwiththemonthinwhichoperationscommenceand
continueeachmonthuntilthewellis physicallypluggedandabandoned.Thisreportwillbe
filedwiththeVernalBLMDistrictOffice,170South500 East,Vernal,UT 84078.

g. ImmediateReport:Spills,blowouts,fires,leaks,accidents,oranyotherunusualoccurrences
shallbe promptlyreportedinaccordancewiththe requirementsofNTL-3Aor itsrevision.

h. Ifa replacementrigiscontemplatedforcompletionoperations,a "SundryNotice"Form3160-
5 tothateffectwillbe filed,forpriorapprovaloftheAO,andallconditionsofthisapproved
planareapplicableduringalloperationsconductedwiththe replacementrig.

i. Shouldthewellbesuccessfullycompletedforproduction,theAOwillbenotifiedwhenthewell
is placedina producingstatus. Suchnotificationwillbe sentby telegramorotherwritten
communications,not laterthan5 days followingthe date on whichthe wellis placed on
production.

j. PursuanttoOnshoreOrderNo.7,withtheapprovaloftheDistrictEngineer,producedwater
maybe temporarilydisposedof intounlinedpitsfora periodofup to90 days. Duringthe
periodso authorized.an applicationforapprovalofthepermanentdisposalmethod,along
withthe requiredwateranalysisand otherinformation,mustbe submittedto theDistrict
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periodso authorized.an applicationforapprovalofthepermanentdisposalmethod,along
withthe requiredwateranalysisand otherinformation,mustbe submittedto theDistrict
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k. PursuanttoNTL-4A,lessees oroperatorsareauthorizedtovent/flaregasduringinitialwell
evaluationtests,notexceedinga periodof30 days ortheproductionof50 MMCFofgas,
whicheveroccursfirst. Anapplicationmustbe filedwiththeDistrictEngineerandapproval
received,foranyventing/flaringofgas beyondthe initial30 dayorauthorizedtestperiod.

l. Aschematicfacilitiesdiagramas requiredby43CFR3162.7-5(b.9.d.),shallbesubmittedto
theappropriateDistrictOfficewithinsixty(60)daysofinstallationorfirstproduction,whichever
occursfirst.Allsitesecurityregulationsas specifiedinOnshoreOrderNo.3shallbeadhered
to.Allproductlinesenteringandleavinghydrocarbonstoragetankswillbe effectivelysealed
inaccordancewith43 CFR3162.7-5(b.4.).

m. A first productionconferencewillbe scheduledwithin15 days afterreceiptofthe first
productionnotice.

n. Nowellabandonmentoperationswillbe commencedwithoutthepriorapprovaloftheAO.
Inthecaseofnewlydrilleddryholesorfailures,andinemergencysituations,oralapproval
willbe obtainedfromtheSO. A"SubsequentReportofAbandonment"Form3160-5,willbe
filedwiththeAOwithin30daysfollowingcompletionofthewellforabandonment.Thisreport
willindicatewhereplugswereplacedandthecurrentstatusofsurfacerestoration.Final
abandonmentwillnot be approveduntilthe surfacereclamationwork requiredby the
approvedAPDorapprovedabandonmentnoticehas been completedtothesatisfactionof
theAOorhis representative,ortheappropriateSurfaceManagingAgency.

o. PursuanttoOnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1, lessees andoperatorshavetheresponsibility
to see that theirexploration,development,production,andconstructionoperationsare
conductedina mannerwhichconformswithapplicableFederallawsandregulationsandwith
State and local laws and regulationsto the extentthat such State and locallaws are
applicabletooperationsonFederalorIndian
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ONSHOREOIL&GASORDERNO.i

NOTIFICATIONREQUlREMENTS

LocationConstruction- forty-eight(48)hourspriortoconstructionoflocationandaccessroads.

LocationCompletion- priortomovingonthedrillingrig.

SpudNotice - at leasttwenty-four(24)hourspriortospuddingthewell.

CasingStringand - twenty-four(24)hourspriorto runningcasingand
Cementing cementingallcasingstrings.

BOPandRelated - twenty-four(24) hourspriorto initiatingpressuretests.
EquipmentTests

FirstProduction- withinfive(5)businessdays afternewwellbeginsor
Notice productionresumesafterwellhas beenoffproductionformorethan

ninety(90)days.

TheonsiteinspectionforthesubjectwellsitewasconductedonFriday,July7, 2000. Weatherconditions
werewarmandsunny.Inattendanceat theonsiteinspectionwerethefollowingindividuals:

Stan Olmstead BLM,Vernal
RobertKay UintahEngineeringandLandSurveying
LisaSmith - PermitcoInc.
MarkEricson PannonianEnergy,Inc.
RobynDean PannonianEnergy,Inc.
HowardSharpe PannonianEnergy,Inc.

1. EXISTINGROADS

a. Theproposedwellsiteis locatedapproximately26 milessoutheastofMyton,Utah.

b. Directionstothe locationfromMyton,Utahareas
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Proceedina southwesterlydirectionfromMyton,UtahalongU.S.Highway40
approximately1.7milesto thejunctionthisroadand an existingroadtothesouth;Turn
leftandproceedina southerlythensouthwesterlythensoutheasterlydirection
approximately17.5milestothejunctionofthisroadandanexistingroadtothesoutheast;
Turnrightandproceedina southeasterlydirectionapproximately6,3milestothejunction
ofthisroadandanexistingroadtotheeast;Tumleftandproceedinaneasterlythen
northerlydirectionapproximately.07 milestothebeginningoftheproposedaccesstothe
east;Followroadflagsinan easterlythensoutheasterlytheneasterlydirection
approximately.02 milestotheproposedlocation.

c. Forlocationofaccessroadswithina 2-Mileradius,see MapsA&B.

d. Improvementtoexistingmainroadswillnotbe required.

e. Allexistingroadswillbe maintainedandkeptingoodrepairduringalldrillingand
completionoperationsassociatedwiththiswell.

f. Existingroadsandnewlyconstructedroadson surfaceunderthe jurisdictionofany
SurfaceManagingAgency shallbe maintained in accordancewiththestandardsofthe
SMA.

2. PLANNEDACCESSROADS

a. The last0.2 milespriortoenteringthewellpad willbe newconstruction.Theroadpriorto
this(0.7miles)isan existing2-trackroad requiringsomeupgrading.

b. Themaximumgradeofthenewconstructionwillbe approximately4%,

c. Noturnoutsare planned.

d. Nolowwatercrossingswillbe necessary.Therearenomajorcutsandfills.Noculverts
and/orbridgeswillbe required.

e. Thelast0.2milesofnewaccessroadwascenterlineflaggedat thetimeofstaking.

f. Theuseofsurfacingmaterialis notanticipated,howeveritmaybenecessarydepending
onweatherconditions.

OIL, CS AND NG
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g. Nocattleguardswillbe necessary,

h. Sudace disturbanceandvehiculartravelwillbe limitedtotheapprovedlocationand
approvedaccessroute.Anyadditionalareaneeded willbe approvedinadvance.

i. Accessroadsandsudacedisturbingactivitieswillconformtostandardsoutlinedinthe
BureauofLandManagementandForestServicepublication:SurfaceOperatinq
StandardsforOilandGasExplorationandDevelopment,(1989).

j. Theroadwillbe constructedlupgradedtomeetthestandardsoftheanticipatedtrafficflow
andallweatherroadrequirements.Construction/upgradingshallincludeditching,
draining,graveling,crowingandcappingtheroadbedas necessarytoprovidea well
constructedsaferoad. Priortoupgrading,theroadshallbe clearedofanysnowcover
andallowedtodrycompletely.Travelingoffthe30footright-of-waywillnotbe allowed.
Roaddrainagecrossingsshallbeofthetypicaldrycreekdrainagecrossingtype.
Crossingsshallbe designedso theywillnotcausesiltationoraccumulationofdebrisin
thedrainagecrossingnorshallthedrainagesbe blockedbytheroadbed.Erosionof
drainageditchesby runoffwatershallbe preventedbydivertingwateroffat frequent
intervalsbymeansofcutouts.Upgradingshallnotbe allowedduringmuddyconditions.
Shouldmudholesdevelop,theyshallbe filledinanddetoursaroundthemavoided.

k. NochemicalssubjecttoreportingunderSARATitleIllinanamountequaltoorgreater
than10,000poundswillbe used,produced,stored,transported,ordisposedofannuallyin
associationwiththedrillingofthiswell. Furthermore,noextremelyhazardous
substances,as definedin40 CFR355, inthresholdplanningquantities,willbe used,
produced,stored,transported,ordisposedofinassociationwiththedrillingofthiswell.

l. Roadrightofwaywillbe requiredfortheportionsofaccessroadslocatedoutsideLease
No.UTU-76262.Attachedisourcheckintheamountof$175.00tocovertheminimum
applicationandmonitoringfees forthiswell.

3. LOCATIONOFEXISTINGWELLSWITHINA 1-MILERADIUSOFTHEPROPOSEDLOCATION.
(See Map"C")

a. Waterwells-
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l. Roadrightofwaywillbe requiredfortheportionsofaccessroadslocatedoutsideLease
No.UTU-76262.Attachedisourcheckintheamountof$175.00tocovertheminimum
applicationandmonitoringfees forthiswell.

3. LOCATIONOFEXISTINGWELLSWITHINA 1-MILERADIUSOFTHEPROPOSEDLOCATION.
(See Map"C")
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b. Injectionwells- none

c. Producingwells- none

d. Drillingwells- none

e. Shut-inwells- none

f. Temporarilyabandonedwells- none

g. Disposalwells-none

h. Abandonedwells- none

i. DryHoles- none

4. LOCATIONOFTANKBATTERIESANDPRODUCTIONFACILITIES.

a. Allpermanentstructures(onsiteforsixmonthsor longer)constructedorinstalled
(includingoilwellpumpjacks)willbe paintedDesertBrown.Allfacilitieswillbepainted
withinsixmonthsofinstallation.FacilitiesrequiredtocomplywiththeOccupationalSafety
andHealthAct(OSHA)willbe excluded.

b. Ifstoragefacilities/tankbatteriesareconstructedonthislease, thefacility/batteryorthe
wellpad shallsurroundedbya containmentdikeofsufficientcapacitytocontainata
minimum,theentirecontentsofthelargesttankwithinthefacility/battery,unlessmore
stringentprotectiverequirementsaredeemednecessarybytheauthorizedofficer.

c. Ifproductionis established,a proposedproductionlayoutalongwitha SundryNotice,will
be submittedforapproval,priorto constructionoffacilities.

d. Allloading lineswillbe placed inside thebermsurroundingthetankbattery.

e. Gas meterrunsforeachwellwillbe locatedwithin500feetofthewellhead.Thegasflow
linewillbe buriedoranchoreddownfromthewellheadto the meterand500 feet
downstreamofthemeterrunoranyproductionfacilities.Meterrunswillbe housedand/or
fenced.

o PEIL
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f. Theoilandgas measurementfacilitieswillbe installedonthewelllocation.Theoiland
gasmeterswillbe calibratedinplacepriortoanydeliveries.Tests formeteraccuracywill
be conductedmonthlyforthefirstthreemonthsonnewmeterinstallationsandat least
quarterlythereafter.TheAOwillbe providedwitha date andtimeforthe initialmeter
calibrationandallfuturemeterprovingschedules.Acopyofthemetercalibrationreports
willbe submittedtotheVemalFieldOffice.Allmetermeasurementfacilitieswillconform
withOnshoreOilandGas OrderNo.4 forliquidhydrocarbonsandOnshoreOilandGas
OrderNo.5 fornaturalgas measurement.

g. Ifatanytimethefacilitieslocatedonpubliclandandauthorizedbythetermsofthelease
arenolongerincludedinthelease (duetoa contractionintheunitorotherleaseorunit
boundarychange),BLMwillprocessa changeinauthorizationtotheappropriatestatute.
Theauthorizationwillbe subjecttoappropriaterentalorotherfinancialobligationas
determinedbytheauthorizedofficer.

h. Anynecessary pitswillbe properlyfencedtopreventanywildlifeentry.

i. Allsitesecurityguidelinesidentifiedin 43 CFR3162.7regulationswillbe adheredto.

j. Alloff-leasestorage,off-leasemeasurement,orcomminglingon-leaseoroff-leasewill
havepriorwrittenapprovalfromtheDistrictManager.

k. Allaccessroadswillbe maintainedas necessarytopreventerosionandaccommodate
year-roundtraffic.

l. Theroadwillbe maintainedina safeuseablecondition.

5. LOCATIONANDTYPEOFWATERSUPPLY

a. Theproposedwatersourcewillbe theDalboOurayWaterFacilitylocatedinSection32,
T4S - R3E. ThewaterUseClaim# is 43-8496andtheapplication#53617.

b. Waterwillbe hauledbyDalboTruckingtothe locationovertheaccessroadsshownon
MapsAandB.

c. Nowaterwellwillbe drilledonthislease.

DM3iCN
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6. SOURCEOFCONSTRUCTIONMATERIAL

a. Surfaceandsubsoilmaterialsinthe immediateareawillbeutilized.

b. Anygravelused willbe obtainedfroma commercialsource.

c. TheuseofmaterialsunderBLMjurisdictionwillconformwith43 CFR3610.2.3.
Constructionmaterialwillnotbe locatedonlease.

d. Noconstructionmaterialswillbe removedfromFederalland.

7. METHODSOFHANDLINGWASTEDISPOSAL

a. The reservepitwillbe constructedsoas notto leak,break,orallowdischarge.

b. Ifit is necessarytoblastthepitareaduringconstruction,an inspectionofthepitwillbe
madebya representativeoftheBLMwitha representativeofGilmanA.Hill/Pannonian
Energy,Inc.anditwillbe determinedifa reservepitlinerisnecessanj.Iffracturedrockis
encountered,thepitwillbe firstlinedwithsufficientbedding(eitherstrawordirt)tocover
anyrocks.The linerwilloverlapthepitwallsandbe coveredwithdirtand/orrockstohold
itinplace. Notrash,scrappipe,etc.,thatcouldpuncturethelinerwillbe disposedofin
thepit. Morestringentprotectiverequirementsmaybe deemednecessarybytheA.O.

c. Burningwillnotbe allowed.Alltrashwillbe containedina trashcageanditscontents
removedat theendofdrillingoperationsandhauledtoanapproveddisposalsight.

d. Afterfirstproduction,producedwastewaterwillbe confinedtoa unlinedpitorstorage
tankfora periodnottoexceedninety(90)days. Duringthe90-dayperiod,inaccordance
withOnshoreOrderNo.7, anapplicationforapprovalofa permanentdisposalmethod
andlocation,alongwiththe requiredwateranalysis,willbe submittedfortheAO's
approval.Failuretofileanapplicationwithinthetimeallowedwillbe consideredan
incidentofnoncompliance.

e. Drillcuttingsaretobe containedandburiedinthereservepit.

f. Anysaltsand/orchemicalswhicharean integralpartofthedrillingsystemwillbe
disposedofinthesamemanneras thedrilling
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g. Achemicalporta-toiletwillbe furnishedwiththedrillingrig.

h. Theproducedfluidswillbe producedintoa testtankuntilsuchtimeas constructionof
productionfacilitiesiscompleted.Anyspillsofoil,gas saltwaterorotherproducedfluids
willbe cleanedupandremoved.

8. ANCILLARYFACILITIES

Therearenoairstrips,camps,orotherfacilitiesplannedduringthedrillingoftheproposedwell.

9. WELLSITELAYOUT

a. Theoperatororhis/hercontractorshallcontacttheBLMOfficeat435/781-4400forty-eight
(48)hourspriortoconstructionactivities.

b. The reservepitwillbe locatedonthe southwestofthe location,

c. Theflarepitwillbe locateddownwindoftheprevailingwinddirectiononthewestside,a
minimumof100feetfromthewellhead and30 feetfromthereservepitfence.

d. The stockpiledtopsoil(firstsixinches) willbe storedon thenortheasternedgeandthe
southeastcornerofthe location.Topsoilalongtheaccessroutewillbe windrowedonthe
uphillside.

e. Accesstothewellpad willbe fromthewestas shownonthePit&Pad Layout.

f. See LocationLayoutfororientationofrig,crosssectionofdrillpadandcutsandfills.

g. The locationofmudtankp;reservepit,trashcage;piperacks;livingfacilitiesandsoil
stockpileswillbe shownontheLocationLayout,

h. Allpitswillbe fencedaccordingtothefollowingminimumstandards:

1. 39 inchnetwireshallbe usedwithat leastonestrandorbarbedwireontopofthe
netwire(barbedwireisnotnecessaryifpipeorsometypeofreinforcementrodis
attachedtothetopoftheentire
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2. Thenetwireshallbe nomorethan2-inches abovetheground.Thebarbedwire
shallbe 3-inchesabovethenetwire. Totalheightofthefenceshallbeat least
42-inches.

3. Comerpostsshallbe cementedand/orbracedinsucha mannertokeepthe
fencetightatalltimes.

4. Standardsteel,wood,orpipeposts shallbe usedbetweenthecomerbraces.
Maximumdistancebetweenanytwopostsshallbe nogreaterthan16 feet.

5. Allwireshallbe stretched,byusinga stretchingdevice,beforeitisattachedtothe
cornerposts.

i. Thereservepitfencingwillbe onthreesidesduringdrillingoperationsandonthefourth
sidewhenthe rigmovesoffthe location. Pitswillbe fencedandmaintaineduntilcleanup.

10. PLANSFORRESTORATIONOFSURFACE

ProducinqLocation

a. Immediatelyuponwellcompletion,the locationandsurroundingareawillbe clearedofall
unusedtubing,equipment,debris,materials,trashandjunknotrequiredforproduction.

b. Immediatelyuponwellcompletion,anyhydrocarbonsonthepitshallbe removedin
accordancewith43 CFR3162.7-1.
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operations,suchascutslopes,andfillareaswillbe accomplishedbygrading,leveling
andseedingas recommendedbytheAuthorizedOfficer.Aseedmixturewillbespecified
bytheBureauofLandManagementintheirConditionsofApprovalforthesubjectwell.

Seedingwillbe performedimmediatelyafterthe locationhas been reclaimedandthepit
has been backfilled,regardlessofthetimeofyear. Seed willbe broadcastandwalkedin
witha dozer.

g. Thetopsoilstockpilewillbe seededas soonasthelocationhas beenconstructedwiththe
samerecommendedseedmix.Theseedwillbe walkedinwithacat.

DrvHole

h. Atsuchtimeas thewellis pluggedandabandoned,theoperatorshallsubmita
subsequentreportofabandonmentandBLMwillattachtheappropriatesurface
rehabilitationconditionsofapproval.

11. SURFACEOWNERSHIP

AccessRoads - ThemajorityoftheaccessroadsaremaintainedbytheCountyRoadDepartment
ortheBureauofLandManagement.

Wellpad - Thewellpad is locatedon landsmanagedbytheBLM.

12. OTHERINFORMATION

a. AClass Illarcheologicalsunteyhas been conductedbyGrandRiverInstitute.No
significantculturalresourceswerefoundandclearanceis recommended.Acopyofthis
reportwillbe submittedtotheappropriateagenciesbyGrandRiverlnstitute.

b. Theoperatoris responsibleforinformingallpersons intheareaswhoareassociatedwith
thisprojectthattheywillbe subjecttoprosecutionforknowinglydisturbinghistoricor
archaeologicalsites,orforcollectingartifacts.Ifhistoricorarchaeologicalmaterialsare
uncoveredduringconstruction,theoperatoris to immediatelystopworkthatmightfurther
disturbsuchmaterials,andcontactthe authorizedofficer(AO).Withinfiveworkingdays
theAOwillinformtheoperatoras to:

OIL, CAS AND ANNG
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-whether thematerialsappeareligiblefortheNationalRegisterofHistoricPlaces;

-the mitigationmeasuresthe operatorwilllikelyhavetoundertakebeforethesitecanbe
used(assuminginsitupresentationis notnecessary);and

-a timeframefortheAOtocompleteandexpeditedreviewunder36 CFR800.11to
confirm,throughtheState HistoricPreservationOfficer,thatthefindingsoftheAOare
correctandthatmitigationisappropriate.Iftheoperatorwishes,atanytime,to relocate
activitiestoavoidtheexpenseofmitigationand/orthedelaysassociatedwiththisprocess,
theAOwillassumeresponsibilityforwhateverrecordationandstabilizationoftheexposed
materialsmaybe required.Otherwise,theoperatorwillbe responsibleformitigation
costs.TheAOwillprovidetechnicalandproceduralguidelinesfortheconductof
mitigation.Uponverificationfromthe AOthatrequiredmitigationhas been completed,the
operatorwillthenbe allowedtoresumeconstruction.

c. Theoperatorwillcontrolnoxiousweedsalongrights-of-wayforroads,pipelines,wellsites,
orotherapplicablefacilities.Alistofnoxiousweedsmaybe obtainedfromtheBLM,or
theappropriateCountyExtensionOffice.OnBLMadministeredlanditis requiredthata
PesticideUse Proposalshallbe submitted,andgivenapproval,priortotheapplicationof
herbicides orotherpesticidesorpossiblehazardouschemicals,

d. Drillingrigsand/orequipmentusedduringdrillingoperationsonthiswellsitewillnotbe
stackedorstoredonFederalLandsaftertheconclusionofdrillingoperationsoratany
othertimewithoutBLMauthorization.However,ifBLMauthorizationisobtained,itisonly
a temporarymeasure.

e. Alllease and/orunitoperationswillbe conductedinsucha mannerthatfullcomplianceis
madewithallapplicablelaws,regulations,OnshoreOilandGas Orders,theapproved
planofoperations,andanyapplicableNoticetoLessees. Theoperatorisfully
responsiblefortheactionsofhissubcontractors.Acopyofthese conditionswillbe
furnishedthefieldrepresentativetoinsurecompliance.

f. AcompletecopyoftheapprovedAPDshallbe on locationduringconstructionofthe
locationanddrillingactivities.

g. There willbe nodeviationfromtheproposeddrillingand/orworkoverprogramwithout
priorapprovalfromtheAO. Safedrillingandoperatingpracticesmustbe observed.All
wells,whetherdrilling,producing,suspendedorabandonedwillbe identifiedin
accordancewith43 CFR
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h. "SundryNoticeandReportonWells"(Form3160-5)willbe filedforapprovalforall
changesofplansandotheroperationsinaccordancewith43 CFR3162.3-2.

i. Thispermitwillbe validfora periodofoneyearfromthedate ofapproval.Anextension
periodmaybe granted,ifrequested,priortotheexpirationoftheoriginalapprovalperiod.
Afterpermittermination,a newapplicationwillbe filedforapprovalforanyfuture
operations.

j. TheoperatororhiscontractorshallcontacttheBLMOfficesat435/781-440048 hours
priortoconstructionactivities.

k. TheBLMOfficeshallbe notifieduponsitecompletionpriortomovingonthedrillingrig.

l. Intheeventafter-hoursapprovalsare necessary,please contactoneofthefollowing
individuals:

Ed Forsman PetroleumEngineer 435/789-7077
BLMFaxMachine 435/789-3634

13. LESSEE'SOROPERATOR'SREPRESENTATIVEANDCERTIFICATION

PermitMatters Drilling&CompletionMatters

PERMITCOINC. GILMANA.HILL
14421CountyRoad10 7128 SouthPoplarLane
Ft.Lupton,CO80621 Englewood,CO80112
303/857-9999(0) 303/771-1101(0)
303/857-0577(F) 303/771-1134(F)
LisaSmith

PANNONIANENERGYINC.
6400S. Fiddler'sGreenCr.
PlazaTowerOne,Suite180
Englewood,CO80111
303/713-0054(0)
303/771-5477(F)
303/713-0047(H)
MarkErickson

N OF PERilITC0
OIL, CS AND i DNG
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ENERGYOPERATING
3333S.WadsworthBlvd.Suite218
Lakewood,CO80227
303/969-9610(0)
303/969-9644(F)
303/838-9675(H)
DanHall

Certification

IherebycertifythatI,orpersonsundermydirectsupervision,have inspectedtheproposeddrill
siteandaccessroute;thatIamfamiliarwiththeconditionswhichpresentlyexist;thatthe
statementsmadeinthisplanare,tothebestofmyknowledge,trueandcorrect;and,thatthe
workassociatedwiththeoperationsproposedhereinwillbe performedbyGilmanA.Hillandits
contractorsandsubcontractorsinconformitywiththeplanandthetermsandconditionsunder
whichit is approved.

Thisstatementissubjecttotheprovisionsof18.U.S.C.1001forthefilingofa falsestatement.

August17, 2000
Date: LisaT. Smith- PERMITC0INC.

AuthorizedAgentfor:
GILMANA.
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GILMANA. HILL
PETROLEUM GEOLOGIST

PHONE (303) 771-1101

FAX(303) 771-1134

June 22, 2000

Bureau of Land Management
Vernal Field Office
170 S. 500 E.
Vernal, UT 84078

ATTN: Minerals

RE: Federal #31-29 Well
NW/4 NE/4 Sec. 29-T9S-R19E,
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

This letter is to inform you that Permitco Inc. is authorized
to act as Agent and to sign documents on behalf of Gilman A. Hill
and Pannonian Energy Inc. when necessary for filing county, state,
and federal permits, including Onshore Order No. 1, Right-of-Way

Applications, etc., for the above-mentioned well.

It should be understood that Permitco is acting as Agent only
in those matters stated above and is not responsible for drilling,
completion, production or compliance with regulations.

Gilman A. Hill and Pannonian Energy Inc. agree to accept full
responsibility for operations conducted in order to drill,
complete, and produce the above-mentioned well.

Sincerely,

Gilman A. Hill

DMDION CF
OIL GAS AND · -D '3

7128 S. POPLAR LANE ENGLEWOOD. COLORADO 80112.
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STANDARDFORM299 (1/99) FORM APPROVED

"Ô °F
r

AUGT
APPLIC FOR TRANSPORTATIONAND OMB NO. 1004-0060

Reger Na 5-22-95 UTIL SYSTEMS AND FACILITIES Expires: December 31, 2001

ON FEDERAL LANDS
FORAGENCYUSEONLY

NOTE: Before completing and filing the application, the applicant should completely review this package and schedule a
Application Number

preapplication meeting with representatives of the agency responsible for processing the application. Each agency
may have specific and unique requirements to be met in preparing and processingthe application. Many times, with Date filed
the help of the agency representative, the application can be completed at the preapplication meeting.

l. Name and address of applicant (include rty code) 2. Name. title, and address of authorized agent if different 3 TELEPHONE (area code)
GilmanA.Hill from Item 1 (include rip code) Applicant

7128S. PoplarLane PermitcoInc. 303/771-1101
Englewood,CO 80112 14421CountyRoad10 Authorized Agent

Ft. Lupton,CO 80621 303/857-9999
L As applicant are you? (cireck one) 5. Specify what application is for: (check one)

a. Individual a. New authorization

b. Corporation * b. Renew existing authorization No.

c. Partnership/Association * c. Amend existing authorization No.

d. State Government/State Agency d. Assign existing authorization No.

-- O Local Government e. Existing use for which no authorization has been received *

f. Federal Agency f. O cm. .

If ehecked, complete supplemental page * If< laecked,provide details under Item 7

6. If an individual, or partnership are you a citizen(s) of the I'nited States? Ya No N/A
7. Project description (descnbe m detail) : (a) Type of system or facility, (e..g., canal, pipeline, road); (b) related structures and facilities; (c) physical specifications

l length, width, grading, etc.): (d) term of years needed: (e) time of year of use or operation: (f) Volume or amount of productto be transported: (g) duration and
tuning of construction; and (h) temporary work areas needed for construction. (Attach additional sheets, ifadditionalspace is needed.)

a. GilmanA. Hillproposestoupgradean existingtwo-trackroadand constructnewroadin ordertoobtainaccesstoa proposed
drillsitelocatedin theNWNESection29, T9S - R19E(Federal #31-29)

Theaccess beginsat a BLMMaintainedroadlocatedintheNWSWofsection39, T9S - R19Eandproceedseasterly,then
northerlyand southeasterlyas shownon theattachedTopoMap"D".The lengthoftheproposedupgradeisapproximately
3900'andthenewconstructionis approximately800feet outsideofLease No.UTU-76262.ROWwidthrequestedis 30 feet.
Landstobe affectedareshownontheattachedpage.

b Norelatedstructuresareanticipatedat thistime.

c. The typeofsystemisanaccessroad. Theaccessroutetothedrillsitewasreviewedat theonsiteinspection.

d. The termofyears needed is 30 years ortheentirelifeofthewell.

e. The timeofyearofuse or operationis year roundforthemaintenanceofproductionfacilitiesandtransportationoffluids.

f. Thevolumeor amountofproducttobe transportedis unknownat thistime.

8. Attach a map covering area and show location of project proposal See TopoMapAttached.
9. State or local government approval: Attached Applied for O Not required
10. Nonreturnableapplication fee: Attached Not required $175.00ApplicationandMonitolingFee Attached.
11. Does project cross mtemational boundary or affect international waterways? Yes No (If "yes, "indicate on map)

12. Give statemènt of your technical and financial capability to construct. operate, maintam, and terminate system for which authorization is being requested.

GilmanA.Hillis technicallyandfinanciallycapabletoupgrade,operate,maintainandterminatetheproposedaccess

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND i.; :NG

(('ontmued on page 2) This form is authorized for local
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If ehecked, complete supplemental page * If< laecked,provide details under Item 7
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7. Project description (descnbe m detail) : (a) Type of system or facility, (e..g., canal, pipeline, road); (b) related structures and facilities; (c) physical specifications
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tuning of construction; and (h) temporary work areas needed for construction. (Attach additional sheets, ifadditionalspace is needed.)

a. GilmanA. Hillproposestoupgradean existingtwo-trackroadand constructnewroadin ordertoobtainaccesstoa proposed
drillsitelocatedin theNWNESection29, T9S - R19E(Federal #31-29)

Theaccess beginsat a BLMMaintainedroadlocatedintheNWSWofsection39, T9S - R19Eandproceedseasterly,then
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DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND i.; :NG

(('ontmued on page 2) This form is authorized for local



13s. Describeother reasonable alternative routes and modes considered.
Nootheraccessrouteswerecon ' d as thisrouteis thernostdirectandcreatesthe arnount
ofsurfacedisturbance.

b. Why were these alternatives not selected?
See above.

c. Give explanation as to why it is necessary to cross Federal lands.

To obtain access to a wellproposed on Federal Minerals.

14. pending applications Gled for similar projects which may provide information to the authorizing agency. (Specify number, date, code, or name.)

15. Provide statement of ne project, including the econornic feasibility and items such as (a) cost of proposal (construction, operation, and maintenanc . , (b) estimated cost of next best

alternative, and (c) expected p ic benefits,

16. Describeprobable effects on the population in the area. includine e social and economic aspects, and the su -ffifestyles.

17. Describe likely environmental effects that the proposed project will have ga; air quality; (b) v «I impact; (c) surface and ground water quality and quantity; id)
the control or structural change on any stream or other body of er. le i existing noise levels; alwLifi the surface of the land, including vegetation, permafrost, soil

and soil stability.

1K Describe the probable ef s thaL the proposed proiect n ill have on ia> populations of fish. plant, wildlife, and marine life.including threatened ak dangered
species: and lb) n ne mamrnals, including hunting, capturing. collecting, or killing these animals.

19. State whether any hazardous materiaL as defined in this papagraph. will be used. produced, transported or stored on or within the right-of-way or any of the right-of-way
facilities.or used in the construction, operation. maintenance or termination of the right-of-way or any of its facilities. "Hazardousmaterial" means any substance.
pollutant or contaiminant that is listed as hazardous under the Comprehensive Fnvironmental Response,Compensation,and LiabiliLy Act of 1980, as amended. 42 U.S.C.
9601 et seg., and its regulations. The detinition ni hazardous substances under CERCLA includes any "hazardouswaste" as defined in the Resource Conservationand
RecoveryAct of 1976 IRCRA), as amended.42 (..S.C.%i.il et seq.. and ils regulalions. The term hazardous materials also includes any nuclear or byproduct malerfüÌ
as defined by the Atomic Energy Act of 1954, as amended.42 C.S.C. '-11 et seq. The Lerm does not includepetroleum.including crude oil or any iraction thereof that
is not otherwise specifically listed or designated as a haz trdous suhatance under CERCLA Section 10 l(14), 42 U.S.C.9601(14), nor does the term include natural gas.

No hazardous substance as defined by CERCLA or any hazardous solid waste as defined by RCRA
will be used in the construction or at any time transportedwithin the rightof way.

3L Name all the Department(s)/Agencyfiest where this application is being filed.

Bureau of Land Management
170 S. 500 E.
Vernal, UT 84078
Attn: Cindi McKee

I IIEREBY CERTIFY, That l am of legal age and authorized to do business in the State and that I have personally examined the information contained in the application and
helieve that the informationsubmitted is correct to the best of my knowledge,

Signature of Applicant ÍnOOZO Ag60 Of OllfDSDA. Mll! Date

/ 'Á y August17,2000
Titic 18.U.S.C., Section 100ldadWe43 U.S.C, Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious,or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its iurisdiction.
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'¯¯i PROPOSED LOCATION:
FEDERAL #31-29

LE GEND: GILLMAN A. HILL
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682' FNL 2042' FEL

- Uintah EngineerÏng& Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I C 7 2 00
85 South 200 East Vernal, I.Ttah 84078 Ëf Å Ë MONTH DAY YEAR

(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 189-1813
SCALE:1"=2000' DRAWNBY:C.G.
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Attachmentto RoadRightofWay
GilmanA.Hill
Federal#31-29
Section29,T9S - R19E
UintahCounty,Utah

Landsto be AffectedOutsideof
Lease No.UTU-76262

T9S - R19E
Section29: E/2NWl4,NESW
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0 0
RIGHTOFWAYAPPLICATION
GilmanA.Hill
Federal#31-29
NWNESec.29,T9S- R19E
UintahCounty,Utah Page i

Allroads willbe maintainedas necessary topreventerosionandaccommodateyear
roundtraffic.The roadwillbe maintainedina safeuseablecondition.

g. Constructionwillbeginimmediatelyuponapprovalofthisapplication.Itis estimatedthe
durationofconstructionwillbe 3 days,

h. Notemporaryworkareaswillbe required.

DMDION OF
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APPLICATION FOR TRANSl'3RTATION AND UTILITY SYSTEMS

9 AND FAClLITil S ON FEDERAL LANDS

GENERAL INFOR .TION Department of Tran tation

ALASKA NATIONALINTEREST LANDS Federal Aviation Administration
Alaska Region AAL-4,222 West 7th Ave.,Box 14

This application will be used when applying for a right-of-wav. Anchorage, Alaska 99503-7587

permit, license, lease, or certificate for the use of Federal lands Telephone: (907) 271-5285
which lie within conservation system units and National Recreation
or ConservationAreas as defined in the Alaska National Interest NOTE - TrieDepartmentof Transportation has established the above central

Lands ConservationAct. Conservation system units include the filing point for agencies with that Department. Affected agencies are: Federal

NationalPark System,NationalWildlife RefugeSystem,National Aviation Administration (FAA), Coast Guard (USCG), Federal Highway
Wild and Scenic Rivers Systems. National Trails System. National Administration (FHWA), FederalRailroad Administration (FRA).

Wilderness PreservationSystem, and National Forest Monuments.
OTHER THANALASKA NATIONALINTEREST LANDS

Transportation and utility systems and facility uses for which thè
application may be used are: Use of this form is not limited to National InterestConservation

Lands of Alaska.

1. Canals, ditches, flumes, laterals, pipes, pipelines, tunnels.
and other systems for the transportation of water. Individualdepartmentslagencies may authorize the use of this
1 Pipelinesand other systems for the transportation of liquidsother form by applicants for transportation and utility systems and

than water, including oil, natural gas, synthetic liquid and facilities on other Federal lands outside those areas described

gaseous fuels, and any refined product produced therefrom. above.

3. Pipelines, slurry and emulsion systems, and conveyor belts for
transportation of solid rnaterials. For proposals located outside of Alaska, applications will be filed

4. Systems for the transtnission and distribution of electric at the local agency office or at a location specified by the respon-

energy. sible Federal agency.

5. Systems for transmissionor reception of radio, television,
telephone, telegraph, and other electronic signals. and other means SPECIFIC INSTRUCTIONS
of communications. (Itemsnot listed are self-explanatory)

6. Improved rights-of-way for snow machines, air cushion
vehicles, and al-terrain vehicles. Item
7. Roads, highways, railroads, tunnels, tramways, airports.
landing strips, docks. and other systems of general transportation. 7 Attach preliminary site and facility construction plans. The

responsible agency will provide instructionswhenever speci-

fic plans are required.

This application must be filed simultaneousiv with each Federal
department or agency requiring authorization to establish and 8 Generally, the map must show the section(s), township(s),

operate your proposal. and range(s) within which the proiect is to be located. Show
the nronosed location of the nroiect on the man as accuratelv
as possible. Some agencies require detailed survey maps. The

in Alaska, the following agencies will help the applicant file an responsible agency will provide additional instructions.

application and identify the other agencies the applicam should
contact and possibly file with 9, 10. and 12 - The responsible agency will provide additional

instructions.
Department of Agriculture
Regional FOfesEet. Forest Service (I Si S) 13 Providing information on altemate routes and modes in as

FederalOffice Building, P.O. Box 21628 much detail as possible, discussingwhy certain routes or modes
Juneau, Alaska 99802-1628 were reiected and why it is necessary to cross Federal lands
Telephone: (907) 586-7847 mr a local Fore.G Sen ice O//ice) will assist the agency(ies) in processing your application

and reaching a final decision. Include only reasonable
altemate routes and modes as related to current technology

Departtnent of the Interior and economics.
Bureau of Indian Affairs (BIA) 14 The responsible agency will provide instructions.

Juneau Area Office
9109 MeadenhallMall Road, Suite 5. FederalBuilding Annex 15 Generally, a simple statement of the purpose of the proposal will

Juneau, Alaska 99802 be sufficient. However,major proposals located in critical
Telephone: (907) 586-7177 or sensitive areas may require a full analysis with additional

specific information. 111eresponsible agency will provide
additional instructions.

Bureau of Land Management (BLND
222 West 7th Ave.. Box 13 16 through 19 - Providing this informationin as much detail as

Anchorage, Alaska 99513-7599 possible will assist the Federal agency(ies) in processing

Telephone: (907) 271-5477 ior a local BLM Ofpre; the application and reaching a decision. When completing
these items, you should use sound judgmentin furnishing
relevant information. For example, if the project is not near a

National Park Service (NPS) stream or other body of water, do not address this subject.
Alaska Regional office, 2525 Gambell SL Rm. 107 The responsible agency will provide additional instructions.
Anchorage. Alaska 99503-2802
Telephone: (907) 257-25R5 Application must be signed by the applicant o applicant&

authorized representative. - -- A .J

U.S. Fish & Wildlife Service (FWS)
Office of the Regional Director

1011 East Tudor Road
Anchorage. Alaska 90503
Telephone: (90T> 786-3440 OIL, CAS AND i .3

Note-Filings with any Interior agency mav be filed with any office

noted above or with the: Office of the Secretarvof the Interior. If additional space is needed to complete any item, please put the

Regional Environmental Officer. 13ox 120. 1675 C Street, Anchor- information on a separate sheet of paper and identifyit as "Contin-

age, Abska 99513. uation of Item".

(For supplemental. see page -/) SF-299, page
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I - PRIVATE CORPORATIONS

a. Articles of Incorporation O O
b. CorporationBylaws

c. A certification from the State showing the corporation is in goixi standing and is entitled to operate within the State O O
d. Copy of resolution authorizing filing O O
e. The name and address of each shareholder owning 3 percentor more of the shares, together with the number and percentage of any

class of voting shares of the entity which such shareholder is authorized to vote and the name and address of each affiliate of the entity

together with, in the case of an affiliate controlled by the entity, the number of shares and the percentage of any class of voting stock of

that affiliate owned, directly or indirectly,by that entity, and in the case of an affiliate which controls that entity, the number of shares

and the percentage of any class of voting stock of that entity owned, directly orindirectly, by the affiliate.

f. If application is for an oil or gas pipeline, describe any related right-of-way or ternponary use permit applications, and identify

previousapplications.

g. If application is for an oil and gas pipeline, identify al1Federal land by agency impacted by proposal. O O
II - PUBLIC CORPORATIONS

a. Copy of law forming corporation

b. Proof of organization O O
c. Copy of Bylaws

d. Copyof resolution authori2ing filing

e. If application is for an oil or gas pipeline, provideinformationrequired by Item "I-f" and I-g" above.

III- PARTNERSHIPOR OTHERUNINCORPORATEDENTITY

a Articles of association, if any O O
b. If one partner is authorized to sign, resolution authorizing action is

c. Name and address of each participant, partner, association, or other O O
d. If application is for an oil or gas pipeline, provide informationrequired by Item "l-f' and I-g" above.

* If the required information is already filed with the agency processing this application and is current. check block entitled "Filed." Provit e the file identi ication
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The Faleral aymcies use this information to evaluate your proinal. Managenem. Infomiation Clearance Officer (W(X30). 1849 C Stæet, Mail Stop
401LS. Washingtm. D.C. 201‡0

No Fedsat agmey may request or sponsor, and you am not required to repond to a

request fx intonation which does not contain a currotty valid OME Approval
Number

BURDENHOURS STATEMENT A reproducible copy of this form may be obtained from the Bureau of Gnd
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APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 08/21/2000 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-33653

WELL NAME: FEDERAL 31-29

OPERATOR: HILL, GILLMAN A ( N1430 )

CONTACT: LISA SMITH, AGENT PHONE NUMBER: 303-857-9999

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
NWNE 29 0905 190E

SURFACE: 0682 FNL 2042 FEL Tech Review Initials Date

BOTTOM: 0682 FNL 2042 FEL Engineering
UINTAE

PARIETTE BENCH ( 640 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 1 E<À-er) Surface

LEASE NUMBER: UTU-76262

SURFACE OWNER: 1 EÃ-erd

PROPOSED FOPMATION: MVRD

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

Plat þß49-2-3. Unit

Bond: Fedt ] Ind[] Sta(] Fee[] V"R649-3-2. General
(No. OQS/06/5Ÿ /Ÿ$ ) Siting:

Potash (Y/N) R649-3-3. Exception
, 11 Shale (Y/N). *190 - 5 (B)

Drilling UnitWater Permit
(No. 43-8496 ) Board Cause No:

RDCC Review (Y/N) Eff Date:

(Date:
Siting:

N A Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:

STI
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OPERATOR:HILL,GILMANA (N1430)

FIELD: PARIETTE BENCH (640)

SEC. 29, T9S, R19E,

Utah OilGas and Minine COUNTY:UINTAH SPACING:R649-3-2/GENST

FEDERA 18-17

T9S R19E * FEDERÆ B-21-¾19Y

I

* FEDERA 7-100

PARIETTEBENCH FIELD

FEDERÆ 31-29
+ FEDERÆ 4-308

I

i
+ FEDER 30B

u i © FEDERAL17300

STATE2-328

| *

31 32

+ RBU13-345

RIVER BEND UNIT

T10S R19E
NATURALBUTTES FIELD

REIU ME
*ABUS3E

PREPARED BY: LCOROOVA
DATE
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5 State of Utah

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210

Michael O. Leavitt PO Box 145801Governor
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Kathleen Clarke
Itxecutive Director 801-538-5340

Lowell P. Braxton 801-359-3940 (Fax)
Division Director 801-538-7223 (TDD)

August 24, 2000

Gilman A. Hill
7128 S Poplar Lane
Englewood, CO 80112

Re: Federal 31-29 Well, 682' FNL, 2042' FEL, NW NE, Sec. 29, T. 9 South, R. 19 East,
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et seq., Utah
Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous
operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date. The API
identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-33653.

S ely,

J hu R. Baza
Associate Director

er
Enclosures
cc: Uintah County Assessor

Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District
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O O

Operator: Gilman A. Hill
Well Name & Number Federal 31-29

API Number: 43-047-33653
Lease: UTU-76262

Location: NW NE Sec. 29 T. 9 South R. 19 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas Conservation
General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved Application for permit to
drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338
• Contact Robert Krueger at (801) 538-5274.

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division, including but
not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water Encountered During Drilling
(Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and completion operations, and Sundry Notices
and Reports on Wells requesting approval of change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be obtained
prior to

O O

Operator: Gilman A. Hill
Well Name & Number Federal 31-29

API Number: 43-047-33653
Lease: UTU-76262

Location: NW NE Sec. 29 T. 9 South R. 19 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas Conservation
General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved Application for permit to
drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338
• Contact Robert Krueger at (801) 538-5274.

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division, including but
not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water Encountered During Drilling
(Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and completion operations, and Sundry Notices
and Reports on Wells requesting approval of change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be obtained
prior to

O O

Operator: Gilman A. Hill
Well Name & Number Federal 31-29

API Number: 43-047-33653
Lease: UTU-76262

Location: NW NE Sec. 29 T. 9 South R. 19 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas Conservation
General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved Application for permit to
drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338
• Contact Robert Krueger at (801) 538-5274.

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division, including but
not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water Encountered During Drilling
(Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and completion operations, and Sundry Notices
and Reports on Wells requesting approval of change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be obtained
prior to



Form 3160-3 FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) OMB No. 1004-0136

UNITED STATES Expires November 30, 2000

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. Lease Serial No.
BEREAEOFLANDMANAGEMENT UTU-76262

APPLICATIONFORPERMITTODRILLORREENTER
6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

N/A
la. Type of Work: DRILI- REENTER

7. If Unit or CA Agreement,Name and No.

N/A
8. Lease Name and Well No,

b. Type of Well: Oil Well Gas Well Other Single Zone MultipleZone Federal
2. Name of operator 303/771-1101 7128 S. PoplarLane 9. API Well No.

GilrnanA.Hill Englewood,CO80112 #31-29
3A. Address 303/857-9999 14421CountyRoad10 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

PERMITC0INC. Fod Lupton,CO80621 Wildcat
4. Locationof Well (Report locarion clearly and in accordance with any State requirement ) ,_. 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk, and Survey or Area

At surface 682' FNLand 2042'FEL
' Sec. 29, T9S-R19E

At proposed prod. Zone NWNESec. 29 T9S-R19E AUG 2 1 2000
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13, State

26 rnilessoutheast of Myton,UT Uintah UT
b. l>istancefrom proposed* 16. No. of Acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit ded cated to this well

locaton to nearest
property or lease line, ft.
(Also to nearest drig. nuit line, if any)

595' 900.18 40
18. Distance trom proposed locanon" 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file

to nearest well, dnlling, completed,
applied for, on this lease, ft

None 12,385' 019$103157173
21. Elevations(Show whether DF, KDß, RT. GL. etc.) 22. Approximate date work will start* 23. Estimated duration

4823'GL Sept. 1, 2000 20 days
24. Attachmerits

Ihe following,completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see

2. A Drilling Plan. Item 20 above).

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest SysternLands, the 5. Operator certification.

SI PO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service ffice. 6. Such other site specific informationand/or plans as may be required by the

authorized office.

25. Si¿nature Name (Printed/Typed) Date

,« t / LisaL.Smith 08/17/2000

AuthorizedAgentforGilma .,Hÿl

Application approval does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would enti a I ant to e mduct

operations thereon.

Conditions of approvaLif any, are arached. DIVl"lOk OF
Tide 18 f..S.C. Section 1001and Title -O E.S.C. Section 1212. make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any deggaggigngv
States any false. fictitious or fraudulent statement.s or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

N Instructions on reverse)

CONDITIONSOFAPPROVAL
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4. Locationof Well (Report locarion clearly and in accordance with any State requirement ) ,_. 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk, and Survey or Area

At surface 682' FNLand 2042'FEL
' Sec. 29, T9S-R19E

At proposed prod. Zone NWNESec. 29 T9S-R19E AUG 2 1 2000
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13, State

26 rnilessoutheast of Myton,UT Uintah UT
b. l>istancefrom proposed* 16. No. of Acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit ded cated to this well

locaton to nearest
property or lease line, ft.
(Also to nearest drig. nuit line, if any)

595' 900.18 40
18. Distance trom proposed locanon" 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file

to nearest well, dnlling, completed,
applied for, on this lease, ft

None 12,385' 019$103157173
21. Elevations(Show whether DF, KDß, RT. GL. etc.) 22. Approximate date work will start* 23. Estimated duration

4823'GL Sept. 1, 2000 20 days
24. Attachmerits

Ihe following,completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see

2. A Drilling Plan. Item 20 above).

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest SysternLands, the 5. Operator certification.

SI PO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service ffice. 6. Such other site specific informationand/or plans as may be required by the

authorized office.

25. Si¿nature Name (Printed/Typed) Date

,« t / LisaL.Smith 08/17/2000

AuthorizedAgentforGilma .,Hÿl

Application approval does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would enti a I ant to e mduct

operations thereon.

Conditions of approvaLif any, are arached. DIVl"lOk OF
Tide 18 f..S.C. Section 1001and Title -O E.S.C. Section 1212. make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any deggaggigngv
States any false. fictitious or fraudulent statement.s or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

N Instructions on reverse)

CONDITIONSOFAPPROVAL
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Well No.: FEDERAL 31-29

CONDITIONSOF APPROVAL
APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILL

Company/Operator: GILMAN A. HILL

Well Name &Number: Federal 31-29

API Number: 43-047-33653

Lease Number: U - 76262

Location: NWNE Sec. 29_T. 09S R. 19E

Agreement: N/A

For more specific details on notificationrequirements, please check the Co oyakfor
Notice to Drilland Surface Use Program. "g

CIL GAS AND i
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Well No.: FEDERAL31-29

CONDITIONSOF APPROVAL FOR NOTICETO DRILL

Approval of this applicationdoes not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable
titleto those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations
thereon.

Be aware fire restrictions may be in effect when location is being constructedand/or when well is
being drilled. Contact the appropriate Surface Management Agency for information.

A. DRILLINGPROGRAM .

1. Estimated Depth at Which Oil, Gas, Water, or Other Mineral Bearinq Zones are Expected
to be Encountered

Report U water shows and water-bearing sands to Tim Ingwellof this officeprior to
setting the next casing string or requesting plugging orders. Faxed copies of State
of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If noticeable water flows are detected, submit
samples to this officealong with any water analyses conducted.

All usable water and prospectively valuable minerals (as described by BLM at onsite)
encountered during drilling, willbe recorded by depth and adequately protected.

2. Pressure Control Equipment

The BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimum requirements of Onshore Oil and
Gas Order No. 2 for equipmentand testing requirements,procedures, etc., for a 5_M
system and individual componentsshall be operable as designed. Chart recorders shall be
used for all pressure tests.

Test charts, with individual test results identified, shall be maintained on location while
drillingand shall be made available to a BLM representative upon request.

3. Casinq Program and Auxiliary Equipment

Surface casing shall have centralizerson the bottom three joints,with a minimumof one
centralizer per joint.

In addition, to the cementing proposal for the surface casing, a minimum of 200 ft.
of Class G neat cement shall be placed from 200 ft. to surface in the 9 5/8" X 13
3/8" annulus.

As a minimum, the usable water and oilshale resources shall be isolated and/or protected
by having a cement top for the production casing at least 200 ft. above the shallowest
potential productive zone, as determined from the open hole logs.

4. Mud Program and Circulatinq Medium

Hazardous substances specificallylisted by the EPA as a hazardous gg Ca k i
demonstrating a characteristicof a hazardous waste willnot be used in drilling, testing, or
completionoperations, gg
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Well No.: FEDERAL 31-29

5. Coring, Loqqinq and Testinq Program

A cement bond log (CBL) willbe run from the production casing shoe to the top of cement
and shall be utilized to determine the bond quality for the production casing. Submit a field
copy of the CBL to this office.

6. Notifications of Operations

Operator shall reportproduction data to MMSpursuant to 30 CFR 216.5 using form
MMS/3160.

The date on which production is commencedor resumed willbe construed for oil wells as
the date on which liquid hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped from a temporarystorage
facility, such as a test tank, and for which a run ticket is required to be generated or, the
date on which liquidhydrocarbons are first produced into a permanent storage facility,
whichever first occurs; and, for gas wells as the date on which associated liquid
hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped from a temporarystorage facility,such as a test
tank, and for which a run ticketis required to be generated or, the date on which gas is first
measured through permanent metering facilities, whichever first occurs.

7. Other Information

Section 102(b)(3) of the Federal Oiland Gas Royalty Management Act of 1982, as
implemented by the applicableprovisions of the operatingregulations at Title 43 CFR
3162.4-1(c), requires that "notlater than the 5th business day after any well begins
production on whichroyalty is due anywhere on a lease site or allocatedto a lease site, or
resumes production in the case of a well which has been offproduction for more than 90
days, the operator shall notifythe authorized officer by letter or sundry notice, Form 3160-
5, or orallyto be followed by a letter or sundry notice, of the date on which such production
has begun or resumed."

Ifyou fail to complywith this requirement in the manner and time allowed, you shall be
liable for a civilpenalty of up to $10,000per violation for each day such violation continues,
not to exceed a maximum of 20 days. See Section 109(c)(3) of the Federal Oiland Gas
Royalty Management Act of 1982 and the implementing regulations at Title 43 CFR 3162.4-
1(b)(5)(ii).

In the event after-hours approvalsare necessary, please contact one of the following
individuals:

Ed Forsman (435) 789-7077(Home) (435) 646-1685 (Pager)
Petroleum Engineer

Jerry Kenczka (435) 781-1190
Petroleum Engineer

BLMFAXMachine (435)
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Well No.: FEDERAL 31-29

EPA'S LIST OF NONEXEMPTEXPLORATIONANDPRODUCTION WASTES

While the following wastes are nonexempt, they are not necessarily hazardous.

Unused fracturing fluids or acids
Gas plant cooling towercleaningwastes
Painting wastes

Oiland gas service companywastes, such as emptydrums, drum rinsate, vacuum truckrinsate,
sandblast media, painting wastes, spend solvents, spilledchemicals,and waste acids

Vacuum truckand drum rinsate from trucksand drums, transportingor containing nonexempt
waste
Refinery wastes

Liquid and solidwastes generated by crude oiland tank bottom reclaimers

Used equipment lubrication oils
Waste compressor oil,filters, and blowdown

Used hydraulic fluids

Waste solvents
Waste in transportationpipeline-related pits

Caustic or acid cleaners
Boilercleaningwastes
Boiler refractory bricks

Incinerator ash
Laboratory wastes
Sanitary wastes
Pesticide wastes
Radioactive tracer wastes
Drums, insulation and miscellaneous solids.

DMOiOM CF
OIL, GAS
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Well No.: FEDERAL 31-29

SURFACE USE PROGRAM
Conditions of Approval (COA)

Gilman Hill - Well No. 31-29

Plans For Reclamation Of Location

All seeding for reclamation operations at this location shall use the following seed mixture:

galleta grass Hilariajamessi 3 lbslacre
gardner saltbush Atriplex gardneri 3 lbs/acre
shadscale Atriplex confertifolia 4 lbslacre
globe mallow Sphaeralcea coccinea 2 lbs/acre

Ifthe seed mixture is to be aeriallybroadcasted, the pounds per acre shall be doubled. AII
seed poundages are in Pure Live Seed.

Immediately afterconstructionthestockpiledtopsoilwillbe seeded and the seed worked into
the soil by "walking" the pile withcaterpillar tracks.

Forfinal abandonmentalltopsoilshallbe spread over the recontoured surface and the soils
seeded.

Other Information

Prevent workers at the well from utilizing the "twotrack"road that extends north from the
access road. Ifthisroute receives travelfrom well operations the operator maybe required
to perform reclamation work on disturbed surfaces.
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FORM 3160-5 ITED STATES FoRM APPROVED

(June 1990) DEPAR -NT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

BUREA F LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU -76262

Do not use thisform for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry a different reservoir. 6. lf Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT -" for such proposals N/A

7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE N/A
1.Type of Well

Oil Gas 8. Well Name and No.

well X Well Other Federal 31-29
9. API Well No.

2. Name of Operator 43-047-33653
Phillips Petroleum Company, E&P Americas Division, Rocky Mountain Region 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

3. Address and Telephone No. Wildcat
P.O. Box 3368, Englewood, Colorado 80155-3368 Phone: (918) 661-7283 1l. County or Parish, State

4, Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., m., or Survey Description)

682 ft. FNL, 2042 ft. FEL, NWNE, Sec. 29, T9S R19E, Uintah County, Utah Uintah, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(si TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE Of' ACTION

¯

Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans

Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection

X Other CHANGE OF OPERATOR Dispose Water

(Note: Report results of Inultiple completion on Well

Completion or Recornpletion Report and Log form)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is direction-

ally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Effective December 18, 2000, please be advised that Phillips Petroleum Company (Phillips) is considered to be the
Operator of the Federal 31-29 Well ; NW Quarter, NE Quarter, Section 29, T9S, R19E; Lease UTU-76262;UIntah County,
Utah; and is responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease for the operations conducted upon the leased
lands. Bond coverage is provided by General Insurance Co. of America, Policy #888912. This well was prevlously
operated by Gilman A. Hill.

RECEIVED
DEC2 7 2000
DIVISION OF

OIL GAS AND MINING

14. I hereby certify th the foreg n correct

Signed I Q Title HES Supervisor-Rocky Mountain Region Date 21-Dec-00

Signe

J e'phen de Albu que

Title Date

Gillman A. Hill

(This space for Federal or State ofYice use)

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious
or fradulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse
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Effective December 18, 2000, please be advised that Phillips Petroleum Company (Phillips) is considered to be the
Operator of the Federal 31-29 Well ; NW Quarter, NE Quarter, Section 29, T9S, R19E; Lease UTU-76262;UIntah County,
Utah; and is responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease for the operations conducted upon the leased
lands. Bond coverage is provided by General Insurance Co. of America, Policy #888912. This well was prevlously
operated by Gilman A. Hill.

RECEIVED
DEC2 7 2000
DIVISION OF

OIL GAS AND MINING

14. I hereby certify th the foreg n correct

Signed I Q Title HES Supervisor-Rocky Mountain Region Date 21-Dec-00

Signe

J e'phen de Albu que

Title Date

Gillman A. Hill

(This space for Federal or State ofYice use)

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious
or fradulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
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PHRUPS PHILLIPS PETROLEUM COMPANY

P.O. Box 3368
Englewood, Colorado 80155-3368

December 22, 2000

Change-Of-Operator
Lease UTU-76262
Federal 31-29 Well
NW NE Sec.29 T9S R19E
Uintah County, Utah

Mr. Gillman A. Hill
7128 South Poplar Lane
Englewood, Colorado 80fi2

Dear Mr. Hill:

Phillips Petroleum Company (Phillips) in the process of notifying the State of
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (DOGM) and the U.S. Bureau of Land
Management (BLM) of the Change of Operator for the Federal 31-29 Well
located in the NW NE of Sec. 29, T9S, R19E, Uintah County, Utah.

Phillips has provided the BLM with a self-certificationof Change of Operator via
Sundry Notice. A copy of this Sundry Notice is being sent to you under separate
cover. Your signature was not required for the BLM Sundry Notice. However,
your signature is required for the State of Utah Change of Operator notification.

I have added a line to the standard BLM Sundry Notice form for your signature. I
respectfully ask that you sign each of the five enclosed copies and send one to
Mr. Jimmy Thompson of DOGM (envelope enclosed) in Salt Lake City, keep one
for your records, and send the remaining three to me at:

Steve de Albuquerque
PHILLIPS PETROLEUM COMPANY
1338 Phillips Building
Bartlesville, OK 74004.

I will be moving to Denver on February, but until I move I will be working out of
Bartlesville.

Thank you in advance for your assistance in completing the State of Utah
Change of Operator for the referenced well.

DMSION OF
OIL, GAS AND
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PimUPS PHILLIPS PETROLEUM COMPANY
P.O. Box 3368
Englewood, Colorado 80155-3368

December 21, 2000

Change-Of-Operator
Lease UTU-76262
Federal 31-29 Well
NW NE Sec.29 T9S R19E
Uintah County, Utah

FACSIMILIE

Mr. Ed Forsman
Bureau of Land Management
Vernal Field Office
170 South 500 East
Vernal, Utah 84078

Dear Mr. Forsman:

The purpose of this letter is to notifythe Vernal Field Office of the Bureau of Land
Management that effective December 18,2000, Phillips Petroleum Company
(Phillips) is considered to be the Operator of the Federal 31-29 Well located in
the NW NE of Sec. 29, T9S, R19E, Uintah County, Utah.

Phillips is now responsible under the termsand conditions ofthe lease (Lease
No. UTU-76262) for the operations conducted upon the leased lands. Bond
coverage is provided by General Insurance Company of America Policy No.
888912.

Please note that Mr. Gillman A. Hillpreviously operated this well. The well has
yet to be drilled.

Should you have questions or require additional information, please contact me
at (918) 661-7283.

Sincerely,

J. St phen de Albuq que, P.G.
HES Supervisor

cc: Jimmy Thompson - State of
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Should you have questions or require additional information, please contact me
at (918) 661-7283.

Sincerely,

J. ephen de uquerque, P.G.
HES Superviso

cc: Jimmy Thompson - State of Utah
W. H.

O O
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FORM 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(June 1990) DEPA ENT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

BURE F LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU -76262

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry a different reservoir. 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT -" for such proposals N/A

7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE N/A
I. Type of Well

Oil Gas 8. Well Name and No,

wen X Well Other Federal 31-29
9. API Well No.

2. Name of Operator 43-047-33653
Phillips Petroleum Company, E&P Americas Division, Rocky Mountain Region 10. Field and Pool,or Exploratory Area

3. Address and Telephone No. Wildcat
P.O. Box 3368, Englewood, Colorado 80155-3368 Phone: (918) 661-7283 I l. County or Parish, state

4, Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., m., or Survey Description)

682 ft. FNL, 2042 ft. FEL, NWNE, Sec. 29, T9S R19E, Uintah County, Utah Uintah, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(si TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPOR¯°, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF AC flON

| X | Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans
Recompletion New Constnletion

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection

X Other CHANGE OF OPERATOR Dispose water
(Note: Report results of multipic completion on Well

Complction or Recompletion Report and Log form )
13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and givc pcrtinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is direction-

ally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertînent to this work.)•

Effective December 18, 2000, please be advised that Phillips Petroleum Company (Phillips) is considered to be the
Operator of the Federal 31-29 Well ; NW Quarter, NE Quarter, Section 29, T9S, Ri9E; Lease UTU-76262; Uintah County,
Utah; and is responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease for the operations conducted upon the leased
lands. Bond coverage is provided by General Insurance Co. of America, Policy #888912. This well was previously
operated by Gilman A. HIII.

14. I hereby cettify that the foregoing is tru d correct

Signed & Title HES Supervisor-Rocky Mountain Region Date 21-Dec-00

J. ephen de Albuque e

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. See 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious
or fradulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse
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United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Vemal District Office

170 South 500 East Phone: (801) 781-4400

IN REPLY REFER To Vemal, Utah 84078-2799 Fax: (801) 781.4410

3162.3 http://www.blm.gov/utah/vemal
UTO8300

February 15, 2001

Phillips Petroleum Company
P. O. Box 3368
Englewood CO 80155-3368

Re: Well No. Federal #31-29
NWNE,Sec. 29, T9S, R19E
Lease No. U-76262
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

This correspondence is in regard to the self-certificationstatement submittedrequesting a change
in operator for the referenced well. After a reviewby this office,the change in operator request is

approved. Effective immediately, Phillips Petroleum Company is responsible for all operations
performed on the referenced well. Allliabilitywillnowfall under your bond, BLMBond No.
ESOO48,for all operations conducted on the referenced well on the leased land.

Ifyou have any other questions concerningthismatter,please contact Leslie Crinklaw of this office
at (801) 781-4497.

Sincerely,

Edwin I. Forsman
Petroleum Engineer

cc: DivisionOil, Gas, &Mining
Medallion
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D.vision of Oil, Gas and Mining
'

ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH 4-KAS -'

2. CDW /
3. JLT 6-FILE

Enter date after each listed item is completed

X Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent

Operator Name Change (Only) Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 12/18/2000

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
GILMAN A. HILL PHILLIPS PETROLEUM COMPANY
Address: 621 17TH STREET Address: P. O . BOX 3368

DENVER, CO 80293 ENGLEWOOD, CO 80155-3368

Phone: 1-(303)-292-6270 Phone: 1-(918)-66l-7283

Account No. N1430 Account No. N1475

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)

API ENTITY SEC. TWN LEASE WELL WELL

NAME NO. NO. RNG TYPE TYPE STATUS

FEDERAL 31-29 43-047-33653 99999 29-095-19E FEDERAL GW APD

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 12/27/2000

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 12/27/2000

3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 02/28/2001

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 562960-0143

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on: N/A

6. ¥ederal and Indian Lease Wells: The BIAI and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM
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Address: 621 17TH STREET Address: P. O . BOX 3368

DENVER, CO 80293 ENGLEWOOD, CO 80155-3368

Phone: 1-(303)-292-6270 Phone: 1-(918)-66l-7283

Account No. N1430 Account No. N1475

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)

API ENTITY SEC. TWN LEASE WELL WELL

NAME NO. NO. RNG TYPE TYPE STATUS

FEDERAL 31-29 43-047-33653 99999 29-095-19E FEDERAL GW APD

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 12/27/2000

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 12/27/2000

3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 02/28/2001

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 562960-0143

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on: N/A

6. ¥ederal and Indian Lease Wells: The BIAI and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM
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Form 3160-5 U ED STATES FORM APPROVED

(August 1999) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
OMB NO. 10044)135

Expires:November30, 2000
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease SerialNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTu 77t.242.

Donot use this fonn forproposals to dri/Ior to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

abandoned well Use Fonn 3160-3 (APD) forsuch proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPI..ICATE - Other Insttlictions on reverse side
7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well

Oil Well Gas Wen Other
8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator gg g
Phillips Petroleum Company 9 APTWellNo

3a, Address 3b. PhoneNo. (include area code) 3 |- 2
Ÿ.Û. 80x 1967, Houston, TX 77251-1967 | 10 Field and Poni or Fyploratorv Area

4. Locationof Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Suroey Description)

(oS2' FNL ./ 2OY2.'FEL Í.0/ADU)T'
ÑWNE See..zf-T†f-g/Ýf //3 e//·-33655 11.CountyorParish,State

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT,OROTHERDATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepm P oducuon (SM/R Water Shut-Off

O sa..c-2 ,,.....2,... Reclamation WellIntegrity

Subsequent Report
Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Final Abandonment Notice
Change PM Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon

O c...., to i.wo. Plug Back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or CoommpletedOperation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximateduration thereof.

If the proposal is to deepen directionallyor recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertment markers and zones.

Attach the Bond under which the work will be performedor providethe Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequentreports shall be filed within 30 days

following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new inte2Val, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once

testing has been completed, Final AbandonmentNotices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the final site is ready for final inspection.)

Norist or SPup

RECEIVED

DivlSION OF
A ,

GAS AND MINING

14. INhma c e foregoing is true and correct Title

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATEOFFICE USE

Approved by
Title Date

Conditionsof approval, if any, are attached. Approvalof this notice does not warrantor Office
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject leas
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 US.C. Section 1001, and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the United

States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statementsor representations as to any matter within its
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O O
PHILLIPS PETROLEUMCO Page 1 of 3

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FEDERAL 31-29 000001
Common Well Name: FEDERAL 31-29 000001 Spud Date: 02/28/2001
Event Name: Original Drilling Start: 01/22/2001 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date Frorn - To Hours Code Subco Phase Description ofOperations

01/19/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 DR 1 05C1DR MIRU Leon Ross rathole rig. HSM Drilled 90' of 17-1/2" hole. SDFN
01/20/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 DR 1 05C1DR Drilled 90' of 17-1/2" hole. SDFN
01/21/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 DR 1 05C1DR Drillied 42' of 17-1/2" hole, for a total depth of 222' GL. POOH. LD 8-1/2"

DP and 17-1/2" bit. SDFN.
01/22/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 CS 1 OSC1RC Prep to run esing. P/U and RIH with 13-3/8" GS, SJt, Baffle Plate, and 4 jts

of 13-3/8"
, 48#, H-40 casing. R/U Halliburton. HSM. Cment conductor w/

260 sks class "G", + 3% CaCI. Pump 25 bbis of water, 20 bbis of gel water,
260 sks of cement, and displace w/28 bbis of water. Plug down at 14:30
hrs. Ciculated 10 bbis of cment to surface. Close in valve on head. R/D
Halliburton. Drilled 17-1/2" rathole and mouse hole. SDFN

01/23/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 DR 6 05C1RC Install cellar ring.RDMO Leon Ross rathole rig.
02/27/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 MV 1 00MMIR BLMnotifiedon 2-16-01 of rigmove, called Ed Forsman at Vernal Office.

Begin mob on 2/19/01. Begin rigging up on 2/22/01. Nelco modifledpit to
accomodate rig. Used cat to pull in trucks. Nebeker hauling water to pit.
Surface casing delivered to J&R construction's yard in Rosevelt. Delivered
trailerhouse, water, sewer, trash baskets, chemical tollets,mud motors,
shock subs, fork lift,gas buster, super choke, and 13-3/8" cutofffor flow
nipple.

Called in spud notice to Ed Forsman w/ BLM, and Gilbert Hunter w/ State
of Utah at 4:00 pm Monday, February 26, 2001.

02/28/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 DR 1 00MMIR Rigging up True #30. Filltanks and make repairs. Install flow nipple and rig
up flowline. P/U Kelly and service. Repair rathole sleave.

Hold safety meetings w/ all crews.
03/01/2001 06:00 - 13:00 7.00 DR 1 00MMIR P/U 12.25" bit, BHA. Prep to spud. BHA: BIt, MM, SS, 3 - 8" collars, 6-1/4"

collars.Tag cement at 192' KB.
13:00 - 03:00 14.00 DR 1 10C2DR Spud wellat 13:00 hrs, 2-28.01. Drill54' of cement at slow rate until8"

collars are below conductor casing. At 368' plcked up speed. Run MMat
115 rpm,and table at 60 rpm. Pumps at 100 spm ea, for 698 gpm, w/ pp at
2000 psi.

03:00 - 03:30 0.50 DR b 10C2DR Survey
03:30 - 06:00 2.50 DR 1 10C2DR Drilling

03/02/2001 06:00 - 13:00 7.00 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole
13:00 - 13:30 0.50 DR b 10C2DR Survey
13:30 - 14:00 0.50 RM 3 10C2DR Rig service
14:00 - 14:30 0.50 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 RM 3 10C2DR Workon Rig
15:00 - 00:00 9.00 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole
00:00 - 00:30 0.50 DR b 10C2DR Survey
00:30 - 06:00 5.50 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole

03/03/2001 06:00 - 09:30 3.50 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole
09:30 - 10:00 0.50 DR b 10C2DR Survey at 2002'
10:00 - 16:00 6.00 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole
16:00 - 16:30 0.50 RM 3 10C2DR RIg Service
16:30 - 22:30 6.00 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole
22:30 - 23:00 0.50 DR b 10C2DR Survey at 2502'
23:00 - 06:00 7.00 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole

03/04/2001 06:00 - 07:30 1.50 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole
07:30 - 08:00 0.50 RM 3 10C2DR Rig Service
08:00 - 11:30 3.50 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole
11:30 - 12:00 0.50 DR b 10C2DR Survey 2966
12:00 - 00:30 12.50 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole
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01/19/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 DR 1 05C1DR MIRU Leon Ross rathole rig. HSM Drilled 90' of 17-1/2" hole. SDFN
01/20/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 DR 1 05C1DR Drilled 90' of 17-1/2" hole. SDFN
01/21/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 DR 1 05C1DR Drillied 42' of 17-1/2" hole, for a total depth of 222' GL. POOH. LD 8-1/2"

DP and 17-1/2" bit. SDFN.
01/22/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 CS 1 OSC1RC Prep to run esing. P/U and RIH with 13-3/8" GS, SJt, Baffle Plate, and 4 jts

of 13-3/8"
, 48#, H-40 casing. R/U Halliburton. HSM. Cment conductor w/

260 sks class "G", + 3% CaCI. Pump 25 bbis of water, 20 bbis of gel water,
260 sks of cement, and displace w/28 bbis of water. Plug down at 14:30
hrs. Ciculated 10 bbis of cment to surface. Close in valve on head. R/D
Halliburton. Drilled 17-1/2" rathole and mouse hole. SDFN

01/23/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 DR 6 05C1RC Install cellar ring.RDMO Leon Ross rathole rig.
02/27/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 MV 1 00MMIR BLMnotifiedon 2-16-01 of rigmove, called Ed Forsman at Vernal Office.

Begin mob on 2/19/01. Begin rigging up on 2/22/01. Nelco modifledpit to
accomodate rig. Used cat to pull in trucks. Nebeker hauling water to pit.
Surface casing delivered to J&R construction's yard in Rosevelt. Delivered
trailerhouse, water, sewer, trash baskets, chemical tollets,mud motors,
shock subs, fork lift,gas buster, super choke, and 13-3/8" cutofffor flow
nipple.

Called in spud notice to Ed Forsman w/ BLM, and Gilbert Hunter w/ State
of Utah at 4:00 pm Monday, February 26, 2001.

02/28/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 DR 1 00MMIR Rigging up True #30. Filltanks and make repairs. Install flow nipple and rig
up flowline. P/U Kelly and service. Repair rathole sleave.

Hold safety meetings w/ all crews.
03/01/2001 06:00 - 13:00 7.00 DR 1 00MMIR P/U 12.25" bit, BHA. Prep to spud. BHA: BIt, MM, SS, 3 - 8" collars, 6-1/4"

collars.Tag cement at 192' KB.
13:00 - 03:00 14.00 DR 1 10C2DR Spud wellat 13:00 hrs, 2-28.01. Drill54' of cement at slow rate until8"

collars are below conductor casing. At 368' plcked up speed. Run MMat
115 rpm,and table at 60 rpm. Pumps at 100 spm ea, for 698 gpm, w/ pp at
2000 psi.

03:00 - 03:30 0.50 DR b 10C2DR Survey
03:30 - 06:00 2.50 DR 1 10C2DR Drilling
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13:30 - 14:00 0.50 RM 3 10C2DR Rig service
14:00 - 14:30 0.50 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 RM 3 10C2DR Workon Rig
15:00 - 00:00 9.00 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole
00:00 - 00:30 0.50 DR b 10C2DR Survey
00:30 - 06:00 5.50 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole

03/03/2001 06:00 - 09:30 3.50 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole
09:30 - 10:00 0.50 DR b 10C2DR Survey at 2002'
10:00 - 16:00 6.00 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole
16:00 - 16:30 0.50 RM 3 10C2DR RIg Service
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11:30 - 12:00 0.50 DR b 10C2DR Survey 2966
12:00 - 00:30 12.50 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole
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Legal Well Name: FEDERAL 31-29 000001
Common Well Name: FEDERAL 31-29 000001 Spud Date: 02/28/2001
Event Name: Original Drilling Start: 01/22/2001 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Code Subco Phase Description ofOperations

03/04/2001 00:30 - 03:30 3.00 DR 1 10C2DR Run ploymer sweeps to clean hole. Drillinglike fractured shale. Unloaded
good slug of cuttings, shaker full. Still willnot drill.

03:30 - 06:00 2.50 DR 4 10C2DR TOOH w/ bit.

Notify Ed Forsman w/ BLM,for sudace cementing.
11:30 am 3/3/01

03/05/2001 06:00 - 06:30 0.50 DR 4 OSC1DR Trip for bit
06:30 - 07:00 0.50 DR 4 05C1DR Break out bit #1, P/U bit #2
07:00 - 11:00 4.00 DR 4 10C2DR RIH w/ bit #2
11:00 - 12:30 1.50 DR 10C2DR Ream 154' back to bottom. Hole out of guage.
12:30 - 17:30 5.00 DR 1 10C2DR Resume drilling at 3266'. 12-1/4" surface hole.
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 RM 3 10C2DR Rig Service.
18:00 - 22:00 4.00 DR 1 10C2DR Drilling12-1/4" surface hole.
22:00 - 22:30 0.50 DR 1 10C2DR Reach totaldepth of 3540'. Sweep hole. Pump gel pill, drop survey.
22:30 - 00:00 1.50 DR 5 10C2DR Circulate and conditionhole. Spot gel pill.
00:00 -02:30 2.50 CS 6 10C2DR TOOH with drillstring. R/U Mountain States Casing Service. Lay down 8"

collars.
02:30 - 06:00 3.50 CS 1 10C2DR R/U casing tools. P/U and run 9-5/8", 40#, J-55, LT&C.

Notlfled Ed Forsman w/ BLMof current schedule for surface casing and
cementing,at 7:15 pm, 3-4-01.

03/06/2001 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 CS 4 10C2RC Running 9-5/8" surface cas\ng.
07:00 - 07:30 0.50 CS 1 10C2RC Fillcasing
07:30 - 09:30 2.00 CS 10C2RC Running casing. Tag bottom at 3571'. Hole deeper than SLM of drill string.

both talliescoralated. There had to have been an extra jointdrilled, or there
was 31' of make up. All tripscorrelated to jt count and tallysheet. Alljoints
were marked and counted for all tubulars.

09:30 - 10:30 1.00 CE 6 10C2RC R/U Halliburton.
10:30 - 11:30 1.00 CE 5 10C2RC Circulate and condition hole.
11:30 - 11:45 0.25 CE 0 10C2RC Held safety meetingwithCementing crew and rig crew. discussed roles

and responsibilities,and safe practices for this job.
11:45 - 13:30 1.75 CE 1 10C2DR Cement surface casing as follows: pump 20 bbis of Super Flush and 25 bbl

spacer. Mixand pump 465 sks lead (238 bbis) at 12 ppg, 2.87 cuft/sk, 15.5
gallsk water of Hi-FIllLead cement, containg class G, 6% EX-1, 1% HR-7,
3% salt, and 10 lb/sk gilsonite. Followed by 360 sks tail (74 bbis) at (first
200 sks at 14.8 ppg due to problem with truck) 15.8 ppg, 1.16 cuft/sk,5.16
gal/sack water, containgclass G , 2% CaC; and 1/4 ppsk poly-e-flake.
Displace with265 bbis of water from mud system. Had retums throughout
jobwithperiods of reduced to lost circulationfor last 100 bbls of
displacement.

13:30 - 15:30 2.00 CE 1 10C2RC WOC. Rig up one Inch to top out. Run in with one Inch tubing. Could not
get past collarat 130'.

15:30 - 16:30 1.00 CE 1 10C2RC Mixand pump twostages of 10 bbis each of class G, w/ 3% CaCI, for a
total of 100 sks. Had retums of lead slurry, rightaway when pumping. Had
slowfalling column after first plug.Walt 15 minutes. Raised column to bell
nipple.Shut down and watched fall. Cement holding, had to dump 5 bbis to
pit. Used a total of 75 sks in annulus. Approved by BLM.

16:30 - 16:31 0.02 CE z 10C2RC Cement Job witnessed by Raymond Arnoldw/ BLM.
16:31 - 19:00 2.48 CE 6 10C2RC R/D Halliburton. WOC
19:00 - 23:00 4.00 WO j 10C2RC WOC
23:00 - 01:00 2.00 DR 1 10C2RC Make first cut on riser. Rough cut 9-5/8" surface casing.
01:00 - 06:00 5.00 CS e 10C2RC Weld on 9-5/8"

, 5000 psl casing head. Let cool and test.
03/07/2001 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 CS 2 10C2RC Weld on casing head. Let cool, then test. Had leaking weld on Inside.
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Date From - To Hours Code Subco Phase Description of Operations

03/07/2001 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 CS 2 10C2RC Attempted to fix two more times withall failing. Wait on welder.
10:30 - 11:00 0.50 WO O 10C2RC Jim Weaver held safety meeting with daylight crew. Discussed Phillips

Safety programand expectations.
11:00 - 14:30 3.50 WO u 10C2RC Walt on welder, and new casing head.
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 WO O 10C2RC JIm Weaver held safety meeting withdaylight crew. Discussed Phillips

Safety program and expectations.
15:00 - 16:00 1.00 WO u 10C2RC Wait on welder,and new casing head.
16:00 - 22:00 6.00 CS e 10C2RC J&R welder on location. Cutoff casing head. Dress offand bevel casing.

Heat new wellheadand install. Let cool.
22:00 - 22:30 0.50 CS 8 10C2RC R/U Single Jack Testers, and tested weldon casing head, all passed
22:30 - 23:00 0.50 WO 0 10C2RC Jim Weaver held safety meeting with daylight crew. Discussed Phillips

Safety program and expectations.
23:00 - 06:00 7.00 DR 6 20SFDR N/U BOP stack.

03/08/2001 06:00 - 06:01 0.02 Have verbal approval from BLMfor change In hole size and production
casing from APD. Approved by Ed Forsman ,BLM Engineer, Vernal office
on 3/5/01.

06:01 - 14:30 8.48 WC 2 05C1EV N/U BOP's,
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 WC 6 05C1EV Hookup lines to accumulator.
15:00 - 16:00 1.00 WC 6 05C1EV Change out lines to BOP.
16:00 - 02:00 10.00 WC 8 05C1EV Perform Stack Test and casing. AIIpassed. Accumulator test failed.

Annular valve stuck open, had to repair.
02:00 -06:00 4.00 WC 05C1EV P/U BHA. Mud 7-7/8" bit, motor,float sub, 24 - 6-1/4" drill collars. RIH w/

drill pipe.
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PHILLIPS CONFilENTIAL

PHILLIPS PETROLEUM COMPANY
9780 MT. PYRAMID CT., SUITE 200
ENGLEWOOD, CO 80112

AMERICAS OlVISION

March 16, 2001

State of Utah, Department of Natural Resources
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Attn: Carol Daniels
PO Box 145801
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Dear Ms. Daniels:

Attached is a copy of the weekly drilling report for Federal 31-29 #1 that was filed
with the U.S. Department of Interior, Bureau of Land Management.

Ifyou have any questions, please feel free to call me at 303-643-4364.

Sincerely,

Jan Evans
Engineering Specialist

OIL, GAS AND
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NM-15-01THU10:58 AM FAXNO, Æ/ P. 02

00NRDERL
Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) OMT) No. 1004•0135

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ExpiresNovembei 30, 2000
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Izase serialNo.

SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ONWELLS 07 "?(Dg (p &
Do not use this forat for proposals to drlli or to re-enter an 6. It Indinn, Allouec or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 37604 (APD) for such proposais.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side 7. HUnh or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type cf Well I

O Dit Wet! Ons Well Odler 8. Well Name und No.

2. NameofO elater ,if

API Well No.
34. Address / \ 3b. Phone No. {includ aran code) OÌ ·

Ÿ.O. Br>x.\%7 ßr,o3 T)( 3-G09-'Wo2. io.viele....r..t.. oratoryare.

4. location of well(Footage, Sec.. T., A. M.,or Survey Desedytion) C.CL

(oña' F/\th o c\ 2M2 FEL li.conmyorroriso.stale

12. CElECKAPPROPRIATI.! DOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, RlIPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OFSUIlMISSION TVPE OF ACTION

O Acidizo Deepen Prochmdon (Blart/Rcaome) Wak.r Shut Off
Notice of Inicnt O Ahm Cabing Fracture Treni O RCClamation Wen lutegthy

Sutmenuent Iteport Caning Repair New Cum.truction O Recomplete O Oth¢t

O ChangePlann Plug andAbandon Q Tornporarily Abandon
FinnlAbandonment Nodcc Q Convertto Injoodon Plug Rack O Water Disposal

13. TAvribo Pro d or Completed Operation (cinnriy state ati pertinent dctalk, including estimated startingdate of any propumedwork and approximato duration thereof.
If the propo.mdin to deepen ditt¢tionally or recomp1stehorizontally give subsurface toentlans and maaAured end truc verilcol depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performedor provade the Bond No. on file wkh BIR/lllA. Required subsequent reports shnu he fited wkhin 30 days
following completion ofthe involvedoperaunna. If the operationresultsin a nwltiplecompletionor rucompletinain a new interval, a Form 316tM shnit be filed once

testing has bren compk•ted.l'inni Abandonment Naders shalt be filed only after nIl reqmtements,including reclamation.have been completed, and the operator has
determined that ihn seteis readyfor final inspection.)

RECEiV

alvis N OF
OIL GAS AND MN NG

14, I heluby certify that die foregoing18true andcorruct
Name (Printed/fyped)

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

r e y
_ _

Tkle Date
Condhions of approval, if any, are attnehed. Approval of this notice does not warram or
cortify lital the applicant hnlds lugni or equitabletitle to those righthin the subject lease Office
which would aniille the applicam m conduci operationsthcreon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Titic 43 U.S.C. Ecction 1212, makeit a crimefor anvperson knowin y and willfully la mako to any department or accuey of the Unitcd
States any falac, feelitions or flaudeleut staternentsor representationsas to any matter wltilin its jurisdict
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ELi, NAME JOR NUMBER EVENT CODE PROG TMD WD DPS NO. DATEFEDERAL 31-29 000001 1. . 1 ODR I .922 8 T74 8,774 16.
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24 unsuMMARY: Hou safety meedngsWRhas crews.Discussed drBIproceduresw/ new d¾er andcrawl andsafe use of tongson trip.

15Wilmml-Wí"

00 00 16;oo 10.00 DRP 4 1002DR Tripfor bit @5
10:00 18:00 2.00 DR P p 1002DR Ream last 150'toTDof8452
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_
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Panted osnamot
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March23,2001 CONFIDENTIAL

Carol Daniels
Department of Natural Resources-Utah

Enclosed is a copy of the sheets we sent to the BLM that you requested. If you have any
questions let me know.

Jan Evans
Petroleum Engineer
Phillips Petroleum
9780 Mt. Pyramid Court Suite 200
Englewood, CO 80112
303-643-4364

RECEIVED
MAR29 2001
DIVl410N OF

OlL, GAS AND
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SENT BY: PHILLIPS PETROLEUM COMP • 435 613 9777; MAR- 1 8:37AM¡ PAGE 2/2

Farm3gy UNITß .'TATES FORM APPROVF.D
uunemoi DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Iludget Bureau No. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT lapires: March 31. 1903

5. I.ease Designation and Serial No.
SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS ( Wi ) 7(p 14>2..Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different rescrvoir- 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe NameUse "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals

7. If Unit or CA, Agreettient Designation

I . T of Vell
Gas

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE

8. Well a c and No.

FO€AAL2.4n (O rato
9. API Well No.

3. Address and Telephone No,
10. Ficid and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Soc.,T., R:, M., or Survey Descnption)

63 a ' r WL ¿ AMt F EL r -29 3 11. Countyor Parish, State

11 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent

Subsequent Repon O Change of Nam• O Change of Pbus

O a-r-- O New Comtrucuon

O Final Abandonment Notice O lassine B• O N°=*="ti=•F-""=

O c6**** * O Water Shut-Off

O ^ier..c"i"= O 6°""•'"'°"*'">'°"

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations ( Cicarly stato all pertinent details, andgive peninent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work, if well is
directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and rneasured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones portinent to this work.)*

RECEIVED
MAR29 2001
DIVISION OF

DIL GAS AND MINING

14. I here v certify that the foregoing is true and correct

(This space for Fedemi or Slate office use)

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any:

statements or representations as to any natter within its jurisdiction.
* See instructions on Reverse
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Mar-24-01 06:11A Mark Iderston 1-- 824 1911 P.02

NAME JOB NUMBER EVENTCODE i ÎRS PROG D DFa EFT NO. DATE
FEDERAL31-29 000001 1 ODR 18 10,997 10,997 23 30 1au envison RIG NAME & NO. FigLD NAMEIOCS ND. AUTH MO DAB.Y TANG CUM. TANG

.M \ .-..Tomoon
.. .... ._.

__w!_ocA.1..
.

..12.LOG
_

0-00
_ . . .

0.00
CURRENTSTATUS AcclDENTS(ASY 24 HMS.1 DAILY INT Wio MUD CUM INTANG WI MUD

Trippingfor.Bit
_ . . .

.. . . _ .... ........__..._ _

_j29&00 _e96,682.91

24 HR FORSCAST DATEOF LAST SAFETYMEEfiNG DAILY YOTAL, CUM COBT WI MUD
Tripfor bit. Orliing7-7/8" Hole 38,856 798,025

UTHOLOGY '
JAN HRs OF SERV100 BHAHRS SINCEINSP i,,gAKOFF AFE AUTN,

SANDSTONE/SHALE WAR.BSD.V001
_1.,_90427__50

LAST suRVEY: DATE TMD ING ADM LAST CAstNG NEKTCAbtWO lART BOP PRES YEST
03/10/2001 9,819.0 2.000

__ _ __

0._000 0.625 (in.)O 3,470.0 (ft) 4.500 (in.) 12700p (ft) 03m/2001

24 NR BUMMARY:Mudupsystem, addweight w/ fxine and bar, TOOH

06:00 11:0D 5.00 WC T DW99 5 10C2DR Circuladngtomirmud and raise mudweightSelviced lig dudng thistime.
11:00 15:30 4.50 DR P 1 10c2DR Resume drilling toallowmud tobuild viscosity and to raise mud welght.9.8 Ifiout.

Conn. 2000 unite,BG 1300units.
15:30 22:00 8.50 WC T DWOG 1 1002DR Mixingbar and ses mud to raisewt.to 10 ppg+. Pump hole volume w/ 10.1 ppg

bar at 68 etkm
22:00 08:00 8,00 WC T DW99 i 10C2DR Gas increasing w/slight flow, increase md wtto 10.4 ppg and pump around at 68

etkm(4,7 bpm). Began lossing fluid.MIK LCM piltw/ 10% LCM.Spot pilland
foion w/ 2% LCM mud. Heeledhole wl onevolume.Check flow 10.7 ppg out 10.2

ppg in. Bulld volume inpits. PooH, pull tutating heed rubber. Gas flow still

651.5 200 0 200 200.0 314 5 50.0 206 0 374.8

coNT NENTAL EM$ 10.000 5.500 120 000 | 351 66 000

EWÖ¾ÑOMONS 5~^ f a 6

timi WUlíd AEÑgggŒf(MAIS BW(

24a.ooo 252 oDO 252,000 A 84 723 92

SIT 1.00 7.825 1.750 4.500 XH

SUS - BIT 1 2.99 8.750 2.250 4.500 XH

DC 24 719.93 6.250 2.250 4.500 XH

Pdntad: 03/25/2001 5:50.50
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Marr-24-01 06:12A Mar a¯Idarston 1- O 824 1911 P.O3

NAME JDB NUMHER EVENT CODE N NR$ PROG TMD TVD DFB REPT NO. DATE
PEDERAL31 000001 i ODR

.

18
. . _

10 007 10 997 23 30 1

Anco Gel 100.00 ha 234
Um0 60.00 lbs

, gg
Anco Ddil 5.00 gal 11 so
Gypsum 50.00 he 60
KUL 50.00 he 122 441
oc3os s.cog.i

5,00gal 2 is
01300 5.00 gul 2 18
CORROSioN RING 1.00ee 6
Muti Seal 40,00 b 160
Senduet 20.00 lb SO
E 1.00 as 1

_ .

,9

Ananbar 100.OÔb 400 1,210
PelleteNvmp

_

1.00 en 24 e
cAus nC SODA 60.00 lb U 40
HighYield Gal 50.00 m 144_ 216
Dispac 50.00 10 12

_ _ _

20
cl300 55.00 gal

_

8
Sea Mud 60.00 lb 300

_ _ _

600
Desco CF 25.00 m

_

40
Transport 1.00 em

_ _ _ _

1
_ ._

4

Pum ostauraxn5:5g50
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APR-04-2001 02:09 P.04/04

FO.:M 3160-5 L D STATES -------.

Gune1990) DEPARTA . OF THE INTERIOR BudgetBumu No. IM135

BUREAUOF LANDMANAGEMENT Expires, ivlasch31. 1993

s. i.ease Designationand serietNo.

SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTSON WELLS UTU-76282

Do notuse thisformfor proposals todrillorto deepen or reentry a differentreservoir, e IfInGan,Adonecor TrmcNgunc

Use "APPUCATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals N/A

1 If Unitor CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE NIA

1. of Well
Oil Gas

8 Well Nameand No.

wou X wen omer Federal 31-29 No, i
9. APIWellNo.

2. Nameoroperatur
43-047-33653

PhittipsPetroleum Company,E&P AmericasDivision, RockyMountain Region 10. FieldandPool,orExploratory Atta

3. Addens and TelephoneNo.
Wildcat

9780 Mt Pyramid Ct. Suite 200, Englewood,CO, 8( Phone: {303) 843-3942 11, Countyor PGüsh, Smte

4. Lacation of Well(Poetage, See.,T., R, sn..or SurveyDescription)

682 ft FNL,2042 ft. FEL, NWNE, See. 29. TBS R19E, Uintah County,Utah Uintah, Utah

12. CHECKAPPROPRIATEBOX(s TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOT1CE,REPORT,OR OTHERDATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

NoticeofIntent Abendomnent Change ofPlans

Recompteden
NewConstmotion

SubsequentItaport Plugging Back
Non-Rautine Fracturing

Casing Itepair
WaterShut4)ff

FinalAbandonment Notice Ahoring Casing
Conversionin 14iection

X othercorrectspudDate ts.pos. waar
(Note Repenresullsofmukiplecomp1¢ononWen

compledonorawampkdonm.portandLes rena)

. DescribePropos.d er temptesesoperaden.(clentlysene an putinent saisits..ndsin pere..ut dares.includingestinmed datwetseming anypr=p..ed work If wen is disscdon-

atlydriDei, give subsurthee locadens andmeassed md true vertical depths for all matliers and appes pertinens to this werk)+

The correct Spud Date for the Federal 31-29 #1 Well is 01.16-01.

APR A 20 •

DIVOF0lt., GAS&MINING

.

. 1
14. I hereby certify tru

signed Title HES&RegulatoryAffairsSupervisor Date 04/04/01

Stephen de Albuqu e

(ThiE space for Fogerat or State office uss)

Approved by Title Date

Conditionsofapproval, if any:

Tide 18 U.S.C.Section1001,makes it a crimeforany person lusowinglyandwillisilyto make to any depanment er agency at the United Stetesany fabe,fictitious

or ikadulentstatemensorsupresentations as 10 any matter within (wjurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse Side
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TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

NoticeofIntent Abendomnent Change ofPlans

Recompteden
NewConstmotion

SubsequentItaport Plugging Back
Non-Rautine Fracturing

Casing Itepair
WaterShut4)ff

FinalAbandonment Notice Ahoring Casing
Conversionin 14iection

X othercorrectspudDate ts.pos. waar
(Note Repenresullsofmukiplecomp1¢ononWen

compledonorawampkdonm.portandLes rena)

. DescribePropos.d er temptesesoperaden.(clentlysene an putinent saisits..ndsin pere..ut dares.includingestinmed datwetseming anypr=p..ed work If wen is disscdon-

atlydriDei, give subsurthee locadens andmeassed md true vertical depths for all matliers and appes pertinens to this werk)+

The correct Spud Date for the Federal 31-29 #1 Well is 01.16-01.

APR A 20 •

DIVOF0lt., GAS&MINING

.

. 1
14. I hereby certify tru

signed Title HES&RegulatoryAffairsSupervisor Date 04/04/01

Stephen de Albuqu e

(ThiE space for Fogerat or State office uss)

Approved by Title
Date

Conditionsofapproval, if any:

Tide 18 U.S.C.Section1001,makes it a crimeforany person lusowinglyandwillisilyto make to any depanment er agency at the United Stetesany fabe,fictitious

or ikadulentstatemensorsupresentations as 10 any matter within (wjurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse Side

TOTAL
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0 0
Iws PHILLIPS PETROLEUMCOMPANY

9780 Mt. Pyramid Court. Suite 200
Englewood,Colorado 80112

April 4, 2001

Sundry Notices
Lease UTU-76202
Federal 31-29 No. 1 Well
NW NE Sec. 29 TSS R19E
Ulntah County, Utah

Mr.Ed Forsman
- - --

-
-

Bureau ofLand Management
VemalFieldOffice
170 South 500 East APR A 20Di

Vemal, Utah84078

Dear Mr. Forsman:
DIVOFOlt.,GAS&MINING

The purpose of thisletter is to transmit,in duplicate, twoSundryNotices for the
Federal 31-29 No.1Well located in the NWNEof Sec. 29. T98, Ri9E, Uintah

County,Utah.

The first SundryNotice corrects the Spud Date for the subjectwell. The second

Sundry Notice respectfullyrequests a change in permitted depth of the subject

wellfrom 12,385 ft to ~12,700 ft.

Should you have questions or requireadditional information, please contact me

at (303) 643-3942.

Sincerely,

J. Ste hen de Albu rque, P.G.
HESSupervisor

cc: Ms. Lisha Cordova- UTDOGM
JimWeaver
J. D.
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APR-04-2001 02:08

FORM3160-5 U D STATES
s,,,,...-..,.. _

P.03/04

Qune1990) DEPAR NT OF THE INTERIOR BudgetButeauNo.1004.0135

BUREAU 09 LAND MANAGEMENT
Expires: March31, 1993

5. Lesse Desipation andserialNo.

SUNDRYNOTICES ANDREPORTS ONWELLS uTU -76282

Donot use thisformfor proposals to drillor todeepen or reentrya differentreservoir. 6 If radian,Anonee or me Nann

Use "APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT -" forsuch proposals NIA

7. If Unit or CA, Agnement Desiµation

SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE N/A

1. of Well

- CONROFNR. ·?.Na1-29No.1

2. Nam¢ ofopergor
43.047-33653

Phillips Petroleum Company, E&P Americas Division, Rocky Mountain Region 10. Fieldand Pool,or ExploratoryAsca

3. Addressand Telephon.No.
Wildcat

9780 Mt Pyramid Ct. Suite 200, Englewood, CO 80 Phone: (303) 643.3942 t1.countyorParish, state

4, LacationofWell(Foolage, Sec.,T.,R., in,, orSurveyDescripdon)

682 ft FNL,2042ft FEL, NWNE,Sec.29, TGSRi9E, Uintah County, Utah Uintah, Utah

12 6HECK APPROPRIATEBOX(s TO INDICATENATUREOP NOTICE,REPORT, OR OTHER OATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TŸPE OF ACTION

Noticeof Intent Abandonment
Changeof Plans

Recompletion
New Construction

Subétqutat Report PIngging Back
Non-RondineFrastating

cningnepair war sauseft

Final Abandonment Nodce AlteringCasing
Conversion to Ipjection

Other
Dispos. Water

(Note x=ponmula of multiplecostpteden == well

Complulien or genempletioAReport and Log €nrin.)

11 DeicribeProposedor CognpleledOperations(Citarlystate all portinentdclails, sadgive pergnentdaica,inaludingasumateddate of starting anyproposed work it won is direction-

ally chilkd, give subsurfline locations andmonured andtras venical daylbs forsli marims andannes penimmt to diiswork)+

Per oral discussions between Mr. Ed Forsman-Vernal BLMand Mr. Paul Dean-Phillips, Phillips

proposes to change the total clepthof the the Federal 31-29 Well from the permitted depth of

12,385 ft to ~12,700 ft.
proved Wthe

Utah Divisionof
Oil,Gas and Mining

14, I hereby certi e to ; correct

signed ( Tide HES& Regulatory Affaits Supervisor Date 04/04/01

. Stephende Alb rque

(This spacefor Fe4¢m!or State officeuse)

Approved by Tide
Date

Conditions of approve), if any:

Title18U S.C.Section1001,snahmsit a crimo forany person wingly and wilindly to snaketo any departmentor agency of dieUtiitedStatesany false,fictitious

fradulent setementsor representations as to any matter withinin jurisdisden.

*See instruction on Reverse
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*See instruction on Reverse
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e
nuws PHILLIPS PETROLEUM COMPANY

9780 Mt.Pyramid Coult, Suite 200
Englewood, Colorado 80112

April 4, 2001

Sundry Notices
Lease UTU·76262
Federal 31-29 No. 1 Well
NWNE Sec. 29 T9S R19E
Uintah County, Utah

Mr.Ed Forsman
BureauofLand Management
Vemal FieldOffice
170 South 500 East APR A200\
Vemal, Utah84078

Dear Mr. Forsman:
DIVOFOILGAS&MINING

The purpose of thisletter is to transmît,in duplicate, twoSundly Notices for the
Federal 31-29 No.1 Welllocated in the NWNEof Sec. 29. T9S, Ri9E, Uintah

County, Utah.

The first SundryNotice correctsthe Spud Date forthe subjectwell. The second

Sundry Notice respectfullyrequests a change in permitted depth of the subject

wellfrom 12,385 ft to ~12,700 ft.

Should you have questions or requim additional information,please contact me

at (303) 643-3942.

Sincerely,

J. Ste hen de Albu rque, P.G.
HES Supervisor

cc: Ms.Lisha Cordova - UT DOGM
Jim Weaver
J. D.

APR-04-2001 02:08 P.02/04

e
nuws PHILLIPS PETROLEUM COMPANY

9780 Mt.Pyramid Coult, Suite 200
Englewood, Colorado 80112

April 4, 2001

Sundry Notices
Lease UTU·76262
Federal 31-29 No. 1 Well
NWNE Sec. 29 T9S R19E
Uintah County, Utah

Mr.Ed Forsman
BureauofLand Management
Vemal FieldOffice
170 South 500 East APR A200\
Vemal, Utah84078

Dear Mr. Forsman:
DIVOFOILGAS&MINING

The purpose of thisletter is to transmît,in duplicate, twoSundly Notices for the
Federal 31-29 No.1 Welllocated in the NWNEof Sec. 29. T9S, Ri9E, Uintah

County, Utah.

The first SundryNotice correctsthe Spud Date forthe subjectwell. The second

Sundry Notice respectfullyrequests a change in permitted depth of the subject

wellfrom 12,385 ft to ~12,700 ft.

Should you have questions or requim additional information,please contact me

at (303) 643-3942.

Sincerely,

J. Ste hen de Albu rque, P.G.
HES Supervisor

cc: Ms.Lisha Cordova - UT DOGM
Jim Weaver
J. D.

APR-04-2001 02:08 P.02/04

e
nuws PHILLIPS PETROLEUM COMPANY

9780 Mt.Pyramid Coult, Suite 200
Englewood, Colorado 80112

April 4, 2001

Sundry Notices
Lease UTU·76262
Federal 31-29 No. 1 Well
NWNE Sec. 29 T9S R19E
Uintah County, Utah

Mr.Ed Forsman
BureauofLand Management
Vemal FieldOffice
170 South 500 East APR A200\
Vemal, Utah84078

Dear Mr. Forsman:
DIVOFOILGAS&MINING

The purpose of thisletter is to transmît,in duplicate, twoSundly Notices for the
Federal 31-29 No.1 Welllocated in the NWNEof Sec. 29. T9S, Ri9E, Uintah

County, Utah.

The first SundryNotice correctsthe Spud Date forthe subjectwell. The second

Sundry Notice respectfullyrequests a change in permitted depth of the subject

wellfrom 12,385 ft to ~12,700 ft.

Should you have questions or requim additional information,please contact me

at (303) 643-3942.

Sincerely,

J. Ste hen de Albu rque, P.G.
HES Supervisor

cc: Ms.Lisha Cordova - UT DOGM
Jim Weaver
J. D.



P.01/04APR-04-2001 02:08

pr¡i 4, 2001

Phillips Petroleunk Company
E&P-Americas Division

PillLUPS Rock Mount=inR•sio=
9780Mt. Pyramid Ct., Suite200
Engicwood,CO 80112 USA
Phone: (303)643-3942
FAX:(303)643-4378
jsdcaib@ppco.com

Steve de Albuquerque
Safety & Environmental Supervisor

FAXCOVER SHEET

TO: Mr. Ed Forsman (435) 781-4410

BLM- Vemal FieldOffice

Ms. Lisha Cordova (801) 359-3940

UT Divisionof Oil, Gas &Mining

PAGES INCLUDINGTHISCOVER SHEET: 4

Ifyou have problems with this fax or all the pages identified did not get to you

please call: 303-843-3942. This fax being sent from fax 303-643-4378.

Ed & Lisha,

Attached are two sundries for the Phillips Federal31-29 No. 1 Well in Uintah

County, UT.

The signed originals are in the mail.
APR 4 200,

Rega ,
A GASgg

Steve de Albuque
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APR-02-2001 00°10 P.02

STATEOF UTAH PORMe
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF Oll.,GAS AND MINING

ENTITYACTION FORM

OperaW Phillips Petroleum Company Operator Account Number; % 1475

Address: 9780 Mt.PyramidCourt,Suite 200
Englewood

tat* T.1980112 Phone Number: (303)648-3942

Well 1

API Number Well Name QQ See Twp Rng County
4304733653 Federal 31-29 nwne 29 98 19E Uintah

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

/ g a y | 1/18/2001 /. / g - o /commen

CONFllENTIAL
Well 2

API Number Well Name QQ See Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Eweetive Date

Comments:

WollAaPI
Number WellName 00 Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number ENective Date

Comments:

ACTION CODES:
A - Establish new entityfor neW well(singleWell only) J. Stephen de Albuquerque
8 - Add newwellto existingentity(groupor unit well) Na P
C - Redesign wellfrom one existing entityto anotherexistingentity
D - Re·«ssign wellfrom oneexistingentityto a new entity Sig
E . Other (Explain In 'cornments' section) HES Bupervisor 4/2/2001

Tide Date
macco)

TOTAL
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SENT BY: PHILLIPS PETROLEUM COMPA 435 613 9777; MAR-1 1 8:37AM; PAGE 2/2

r- m.o., UNITED STATES FORM Arraoven
uwe199u, DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No, 20044135

BUREAU OP LAND MANAGEMENT Empires:March31, 1993

5. Isase Designation and Serild No.
SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U T'( ) 7(p g(p 2

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe NarneUse "APPLICATION POR PERMIT-" forsuch proposals

7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

.T ofWell

SUBMITIN TRIPIJCATE

2. Name of Operator
9. API Well No

§. Address and Telephone No.
10. Field and Pool or Exploratory Ar¢a

1. Location of Well (Footage, Soc.,T., R:. M., or surveyDescription) i O
11. County or Parish, State

N NE Sec-- 29 -795- Ri96 (p ty
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPO RT,OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Noden onntent

Subsequent Report O Change of Nam. O Change of Phas

O *-elo O Nw Cmudo

O "'""^"" """'"°"°° O !==sins a•=* ON •·K•=ti-•Fr*='"ine

O c. in, a.,a a w.t., se...orr

O ^" 'i"= 6•••"= O 6=""""" °'"1· 6"

5 s O °*" O °•¤°•""
(Note:Report sesults ofmekiple compielion on Well Cuanplusioner

13. Describe Proposedor Completed Operations ( Cicatly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated dato of starting any proposed work, if well is

lisectionallydrilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for uti markers and zones pcrtinent to this work.)*

DMOR3N OF
AS AND MMNG

\ he y cer fy th the foregoing is truc and correct

V\ M gf i (,,, Date MM OÒ (

This space for Federal or State office use)

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approvat, if any:

ritte18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and wittfully to make to any dcpartment or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudulcut

statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
* See instrucGons on Reverse
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r- m.o., UNITED STATES FORM Arraoven
uwe199u, DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No, 20044135
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Mar-3O-O1 OS:03A Mark lderston 1- 824 1911 P.02

H WPS¶Eggg
ËdiÑng'Ñapet

WELL NAME Jan NUMBER EVENT CODE 24 HRB FROG TMD TVD OFS REPT NO, DATE
FEDERAL 31-29 000001 | 1 ODR 178 11 755 11,765 29 30 1

auPERVisGR NIG MAMEA No. FIELDNAME0008 NO. AUTH MD OWLY TANG CUM. TANG
MarkBalderalan True Drilling30 | WILDCAT 12,"OO-00 0.00 0.00

CURRENTSTATUS ACOlDENfB LAST M HRS.? DAILY INT Win MUD CUM INTAN@WFMUD'
Drilling7-7& hole 14,330.ÇO _.863,661.62

24 NR FOARGAS'r DATEOf (ABT SAISTY MERI1NG DAII..YTUTAL CUM COST WeMUD

Driling7-7/8"hole 03/28/2001 17g
_ _ _

_.964024

uTNotooy aan una or aanvien aus unaeineneism tsaxopp Ars Aute,
SANDSTONE/SHALE WAR.BSD.v001 1,904,750

I.ASTSURVEY: 04TE TMD IMC AllM LABT CASING NEXT CASING LAST80P PRES TEST
03/26/2001 11,sao.o 1.ooo o.con | 9.025 (in.) g 3,470.0 (A) _4.500 pn.) 12/00.0 (R)

_

03rB/2001

- 4, z-:a 226555:WanfšW3WilmKtionaalmamŒ-
main og e at AM MMMWEWWJEEMMMEfaTE:?i9299~9'
06:00 :00 6.00 DR P 1 1002DR Drang 7.7/8" Iloie maintain11.2;gl mudwt.
12·00 12'30 0.50 RMP 3 10c2DR Als service
12:30 06 00 17.50 DR P 1 1002DR DrMng7-7/8" hole mahdmin11.2 ppg mud *t Driling widl a 4 to 16"Hare. BGG

3000 unne,Conn 8200 txtis, TG 11000 unite.

11.20 11.6 $$ il: 2,768 96,501.96

38 11/10 3/10 4/ 2.0/11.0 / 0 05/ 9.50/ 0. 20,000

a / 1 42 / 45 65 0 / 00.0 381 1 900 736 23.50 182 0 7 74 23.50 182,0 7 74

2 CONT NE TALEMSco 0 000 5.500 130 38 900 381 90 970

250 000 250 000 259,000 723,92

war as mamr
SIT 1 1 00 7.825 1 750 4 500 XH

SUS - BT 1 2.99 6.750 2.250 4.500 XH

.

.0.250
2,250 4,600 XH

High Yield Gel 100.00 lba 270

Lime 50.00 lbs 4 118

AnnoDrili S.00gal 50

Gypsum 50.00 lba
KOL 50.00 Ibs 35

_ .
..

DC305 5.00 gni
De-Faam 5.00 gni
Cl300

_

5.00 gsI _

15

Printed OW2W200174445AM
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Mar-3O-O1 OB:03A Mark lderston 1-. 824 1911 P.O3

Page 2 of 2

WELLMAME JOR NUMER EVENT 000E 34 NNE PROG TMD TYD D‡S REPT NO. DATE
. .

FEDERAI..31 29 000001 1 ODR 178 1.1755 11 755 29
_ _

36 349/2001

lik pairra ¡µgg m,g
C_ORR_OSloNRING 1.0Den 4
Muli So-I 40,00 10 500
Sawdust 20.00 Ib 30

1.00 en 3
Ancobar 100.00b 680
Palela/Wrap 1.00 em 74
CAUSTIC SODA 50.00 b $ 41
Dispac 50.00 b (2
Cl300 55.00 gni 1 3senMud 80.00 lb 250
Desco CV 25.00 b o 80
Transport 1.00 en
superos! B 50.00 b

_570

While Starch 50.00 lb
_ _ _

1_0_
_ _ _ _

_30

..

500gal 5

7:44:45
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0

Paul R Dean

03/15/2001 11:14 AM

To: Janis D Evans/PPCO@Phillips
cc:

Subject: State of Utah

The contact with the State of Utah for theweekly updates and probably all Sundry Notices is CarOI
Daniels;

Her telephonenumber is 801-538-5284. Ifshe is not the right focus for some of the issues, she can
probably direct us correctly.

She requested copies of the same stuffwe send to the BLM. No need to use a State form ifwe have the
BLMform done already. She doesn't need it faxed, but would like it mailed.

Her address is:

State of Utah Department of Natural Resources
Division of Oil , Gas and Mining
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah
84114 - 5801

Attn: Carol Daniels

Thanks,

Paul R. Dean
Drilling, Completions, and Workovers
6330 West Loop South
Bellaire Texas 77401

Office 713-669-3502 Cellular 281-615-3154
Fax
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0 O
STATE OF UTAH FORM 6

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator: Phillips Petroleum Company Operator Account Number: N 1475

Address: 9780 Mt. Pyramid Court, Suite 200

city Englewood

state CO zip 80112 Phone Number: (303) 643-3942

Well 1

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

4304733653 Federal 31-29 nwne 29 9S 19E Uintah

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

‡ g / 30 ¯f ~/ 1/18/2001 / - / /- ¿p

Comments:

so,/ CONRDENTIAL
Well 2

API Number Well Name QQ Sec kp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

Well 3

API Number Well Name OG Bec Typ Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

ACTION CODES:
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) J. Stephen de Albuquerque

B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unit well) Na leas rin

C - Re.assign well from one existing en wuothgrexigting entity
D - Re-assign well from one existing en "ggipgy sign re

E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) HES Supervisor 4/2/2001
Title Date
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Form Šl60-5 UNr 'ED STATES FORM APPROVED

(August 1999) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
OMB NO. 1004-0135

Expires:NovemberB0, 2000
BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeaseSerialNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU Î &2 4 i
Do not use this form forproposals to dri/Ior to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) forsuch proposals,

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instruct¡ons on reverse side
7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well

Oil Well Gas Well Other
8, wellName and No.

2. Name of Operator
9. We No

3a. Address 3b. PhoneNo. (include area code) // - QV

4. IncationofWell(Foo age, Sec., T., R, M., or SurveyDescription)

48g, DL I 2042' FEC /CMAY
. | gg 11. County or Parish, State

Unvr»H <b a UTAN

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATENATUREOFNOTICE,REPORT,OROTHERDATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

Notice of Intent Ade Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

OS mmRepon
U Casing Repair New Construction |__ Recomplete Other

Final Abandonment Notice
Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon

O co...,so1.,«.. Plug Back Water Espel

13. Describe Proposed or CoornmpletedOperation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximateduration thereof.

If the proposal is to deepen directionallyor recómplete horizontally,give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.

Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequentreports shall be filed within 30 days

following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completionor recompletionm a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once

testing has been completed. Final AbandonmentNotices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the final site is ready for final inspection.)

Due to the appearance of hydrocarbon shows on the Mud Log at approximately 4,250' and various other

shows throughout the Green River and Wasatch intervals, the initial casing cementing program had to be
changed from the 1000 sx of Class"G" originally permitted. To bring cement 200' above the uppermost

interval, the attached foam cement job will put good cement from 12,500' to 8,250 and foamed cement

( 12 lb/gal) from 8,250' to surface.

14 e Title

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if an , are attached. A proval of this notice does not warrant or Office
certify that the applicant hol legal or equitab e title to those rights in the subject least
whicn would entitlethe applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 US.C. Section 1001, and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the United

States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its
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14 e Title

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if an , are attached. A proval of this notice does not warrant or Office
certify that the applicant hol legal or equitab e title to those rights in the subject least
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1.1. Well Program Summary

Well : Federal 31-29 No. 1

NW NE Section 29 - T9S -- R19E Uintah County, Utah

Field: Wildcat Type: 2A / 2B
AFE No. WA3.BSD.V001 Drill & Equip Costs: $ 1,999,988
Surface Location: NW NE Sec 29-TO9S-R19E Uintah County, Utah
Bottom Hole Loc. Same Depth: 12,700'TVD / MD AFE Days: 46
Rig: True Drilling Company, Rig No. 30 Daywork Contract

OBJECTIVE- Drill and complete a 12,700' exploration well to the Mancos Shale and test the Mesa Verde

/ Mancos Gas Sands. Perform five small Mesa Verde and / or Mancos stimulations. Stack the frac jobs
back to back and then clean out the plugs and test the well for 24 hours.

Due to the appearance of hydrocarbon shows on the Mud Log at approximately 4,250' and various other

shows throughout the Green River and Wasatch intervals, the initial casing cementing program had to be
changed to bring cement 200' above the uppermost interval. This revised cementing procedure addresses

that
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1.1.2. Casing and Cementing

C. CASING AND CEMENTING DETAILS( 4 1/2" CASING) AT 12,511' MD-RKB

1. Casing Specifications: (Top to Bottom)

PPCo Pw Torque

Depth Description Burst Coll Ten Opt ft-lb Drift

0 - 12,511' MD 4 1/2" 13.5 lb/ft P-110 10230 10070 189K 3660 3.795"
LT&C

2. Float Shoe : Halliburton Super Seal .

Float Collar & Loc : Halliburton Super Seal, one joint above the shoe.

3. Centralizers : 1-7' above shoe; 1 on FC; 1 at the top of the 2 and third joints, and
every fourth joint to 8,000' (30 total).

4. Connection Lock : Thread lock all connections through top of Float Collar .

5. Cementing Plugs : 1st Stage Top plug only. Use Halliburton 5 wiper plug.

6. Circ, Mix, Displace Rate : Maximum practical

7. Spacers : 10 bbl fresh water, followed with 30 bbl Super Flush weighted to
11.2-11.4 lb/gal followed with 10bbl fresh water. .

8. Lead Stage Slurry : 1190 sks. Halliburton 50/50 Pozmix-Premium + 20% SSA-1 +

5 lb/sx Silica Lite + 0.3% ZoneSeal Retarder + 0.1% VeraSet
+ 1.5% Zone Seal 2000.

Base Cement Foamed Cement

Slurry Weight : 14.3 lb/gal 12.0 lb/gal
Slurry Yield : 1.47 cu.ft/sk 1.81 cu.ft/sk
Mix Water - Type : 6.32 gallsk. - Fresh Water 6.32 gallsk. water
Pumping Time : 3-4 hours
Desired TOC : Surface
Total Nitrogen needed: 138,000 SCF plus 40,000 SCF cooldown (2 trucks)

Compressive Strength : 12 Hours -

Tail Slurry : 825 sks. Halliburton 50/50 Pozmix-Premium + + 20% SSA-1 +

5 lb/sx Silica Lite + 0.3% ZoneSeal Retarder + 0.1% VeraSet

Slurry Weight : 14.3 PPG
Slurry Yield : 1.47 cu.ft/sk
Mix Water - Type : 6,32 gallsk. - Fresh Water
Pumping Time : 3 - 4 hours
Desired TOC : 8,250'
Compressive Strength : 24 Hours - 2500 psi.

CAP Slurry : 75 sks. Calseal
Slurry Weight : 15.1 PPG
Slurry Yield : 1.23 cu.ft/sk
Mix Water - Type : 4.8 gallsk. - Fresh Water
Desired TOC :
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Contact Halliburton (Dale Gowan 800 874-2550) during well logging to communicate timing of
cement job. Total calculated cement volume above is based on 25% excess in open hole (0%excess in

cased hole). Use actual caliper information plus 10% excess in open hole for actual job performance.

CAP Slurry intended to keep gas migration from coming to surface.

SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS

A. Make wiper trip prior to running casing if hole conditions require same.

B. Run 4 1/2" casing slowly so as not to break any formation down.

C. See rig up information under General Remarks. Establish circulation and circulate one casing
volume. Reciprocate casing during circulation. Casing will be unable to reciprocate with annular
closed during foam cementing operations. Pump spacers, then nitrified slurry, then switch to tail
slurry, Wash out all excess cement prior to displacing. Displace cement with 3% KCl / fresh
water. Bump plug with 500 psi over the final displacing pressure. Bleed pressure to 0 psi and
check for backflow.

D. Pump 75 sx CalSeal "Top out Slurry" down annulus.

D. Notify the State of Utah and BLM representatives a minimum of 24 hours prior to the casing job.

E. Check slurry density with pressurized mud scales throughout the job. Catch samples of slurry
and dry cement periodically while mixing.

CEMENT TO BE USED MUST BE LAB TESTED
PRIOR TO SENDING SAME TO THE LOCATION.

F. Complete PPCO Casing and Cementing Report (DIMS) and send to the Houston Office.

G. After Cal Seal Plug is set firmly, wait an additional two hours, then cut off casing, install 11" 5M
x 4 1/16" 10M tubing spool.

1.1.3. General Remarks

1. Place marker joints in the string at 10,500 and 8,500' to assist in
perforating the Mesa Verde.

2. Tie Halliburton discharge and pumping lines into the BOP stack to
allow mud to route to the pits and to be rigged up to pump the CalSeal
Cap. Function test annular to be sure it is holding. Close 4 ½" rams or
annular around casing. Pressure test the nitrogen lines ( 1000 psi over
the calculated "plug bumping pressure). Pressure test cementing lines
to 3000 psi.

3. Use batch tanks to contain cement prior to pumping downhole.

4. Wash excess cement out of lines prior to displacement.

5. Release True Drilling Rig No. 30 after installation of tubing spool and
master
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PHILLIPS
PHILLIPS PETROLEUM COMPANY

ENGL O
DACMD COT SUITE 200

AMERICAS DIVISION su i L

April 4, 2001

To: Carol Daniels

From: Jan Evans

Here is a copy of the weekly updates you have requested be mailed to you. Any questions
let me know at 303-643-4364.

Sincerely,
Jan Evans
Petroleum Engineer
Phillips Petroleum Company

RECEIVED

OlVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND
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FilE ""
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4. Locationof Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)

ésa' /¯¯wt. * zova' FEC Ulos

Mo N £ -54, 2.9 - TVŠ A / ŸE u. co-y oLare
12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATE NATUREOFNOTICE,REPORT.OROTHERDATA

TYPEOF SUBM1SSION WPE OF ACTION
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13 Describe Proposed or Coo le eration (elearly state all pertinentdetails, including estimatedstarting date of any proposed work and approximateduration thereof.

If the proposal is to deepen o or recomplege horizon subsurfacelocations and measured and true vertical depths of all ent markers and zories-

Attach the Bond under whi¢h the work be performed or the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequentreports 11be filed withm 30 days

following completion of the mvolved operations. If Ihe o results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once

testing has been completed. Final AbandommaarNodcesshan be filed only after all reqinrements, incluams reclamaliam have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the final site is ready for fînal inspection.)

Due to the appearance of hydrocarbon shows on the Mud Log at approximately 4,250' and various other
shows throughout the Green River and Wasatch intervals, the initial casing ecmenting program had to be

changed from the 1000 sx of Class"G"originallypermitted.To bring cement 200' abovc the uppermost
interval, the attached foamcement jobwill put good eement from 12.500' to 8,250 and foamed cement

( 12 lb/gal) from 8,250' to surface.

Accepted by the
tus Divisionof

\ 2,5 OO 5 a ei me w 08, Om-si Mining

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Dato
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w would antiŠthe appucant to conduct operationstheren A Í
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States any false,Actitionsor fraudulent statementsor representations as to any mattET Within its jttrisdiction.
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_
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LITuotoaf .lAR HMSOF sEnvies BMAHRB SINCli INSP LE.AKor¥ Af E ABIM.

SANDSTONE/SHALE 12.51 WAR.BSDVOO1 1.999.968

LAS DATE

1) 5)O.0 1 00Q
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myi mm SHE MMay. rYPE BEmAL NO. .IATSOR TFA DEVW W Dam a i -8-0

I ij .

7 875 tWy XS44 744960 14/14/14/// 12 150 0 04/02/2001 1-1-N E4-NO-TD

EST I RUN

CUM CUM ROP

p us-2001
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1.1. WeilProgram Summary

Well : Federal 31-29 No. 1

NW NE Section 29 - TOS- R19E Uintah County, Utah

Field: Wildcat Type: 2A / 2B
AFE No. WA3.BSD.VOO1 Drill deEquip Costs: $ 1,999,988

Surface Location: NW NE Sec29-TO9S-R19E Uintah County, Utah

Bottom Hole Loc. Same Depth: 12,700'TVD / MD AFE Days: 46

Rig: True Drilling Company, Rig No. 30 Daywork Contract

OBJECTIVE. Drill and complete a 12,700' exploration well to the Mancos Shale and test the Mosa Verde

/ MancosGas Sands. Performfive small MosaVerde and / or Mancos stimulations. Stack the frac jobs

back to back and then clean out the plugs and test the well for 24 hours.

1.1.1.

Due to the appearance of hydrocarbon shows on the MudLog at approximately 4,250' and various other

shows throughout the Green River andWasatch intervals, the initial casingcementing program had to be

changed to bring cement 200' above the uppermost interval. This revised comenting procedure addresses

that
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1.1.2. Casing and Cementing

C. CASING AND CEMENTINGDETAILS( 4 1/2" CASING) AT 12þ11' MD-RKB

1. Casing Specifications: (Top to Bottom)

PPCo Pw Torque

Depth Description Burst Coll Ten Opt ft-lb Drift

0 - 12,511' MD 4 1/2" 13.5 lb/ft P-110 10230 10070 189K 3660 3.795"

LT&C

2. Float Shoe ; HalliburtonSuper Seal .

Float Collar & Loc : HalliburtonSuper Seal, onc joint above the shoo.

3. Centralizers : 1-7 above shoe;1 onFC; 1 at the top of the 2" and third joints, and

every fourth joint to 8,000' (30total).

4. Connection Lock : Thread lock all connections through topof Float Co11ar ,

5. Cementing Plugs : 1st Stage Topplug only. Use Halliburton 5 wiper plug.

6. Cire, Mix, Displace Rate .
Maximum practical

7. Spacers : 10 bbl fresh water, followed with 30 bbl Super Flush weighted to
11,2-11.4 lb/gal followed with 10 bbl fresh water, .

8. Lead Stage Slurry : 1190 sks. Halliburton 50/60 Pommix-Premium+ 20% SSA-1 +

5 lb/sx Silica Lite + 0.3% Zonesea1Retarder + 0.1% Voraset
+ 1.5% Zone Seal 2000.

Base Cement Foamed Cement

Sluny Weight : 14.3 lb/gal 12.0 lb/gal

Slurry Yield ; 1.47 cu.ft/sk 1.81 cu.ft/sk

Mix Water - Type : 6.37 gallsk. - Fresh Water 6.32 gallsk. watet

Pumping Time : 3-4 hours
Desirod TOC : Surface
Total Nitrogen needed: 138,000 SCF plus 40,000 SCF cooldown (2 trucks)

Compressive Strength ; 12Hours -

Tail Slurry : 825 sks. Halliburton 50/50Pozmix-Premium + + 20% SSA-1 +

5 lb/sx Silica Lito + 0.3% ZoneSeal Retarder + 0.1% VeraSet

Slurry Weight ; 14.3PPG
Slurry Yield : 1.47 cu.ft/sk

Mix Water - Type : 6.32gallsk. - Fresh Water
Pumping Time : 3 - 4 hours
Desired TOC : 8,250'
Compressive Strongth : 24 Hours - 2500 psi.

CAP Slorry : 75 sks. Calseal
slurryWeight : 15.1 PPG
Slurry Yield : 1.23 cu.ft/sk
Mix Water - Type : 4.8 gallsk. - Frosh Water
Desired TOC
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Contact Halliburton (Dale Gowan 800 874-2550} duringwell logging to communicare timing of
c¢mentjob-Total calculated cement volume above is based on 25% excess in open hole (0%excessin

cased hole). Use actual caliper information plus 10% excess in open hole for actual job performance.

CAP Slurry intended to keep gas migration from coming to surface.

SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS

A. Make wiper trip prior to running casing if hole conditions require same.

B. Run 4 1/2" casing slowly so as not to break any formation down.

C. See rig up information under General Remarks. Establish circulation and circulate one casing
volume. Reciprocate casing during circulation. Casing will be unable to reciprocate with annular

closed during foam cementing operations. Pump spacers, then nitrified slurry, then switch to tail

slurry. Wash out all excess cement prior to displacing. Displaco cement with 3% KCl / fresh

water. Bump plug with 500 psi over the final displacing pressure, Bleed pressure to o psi and

check for backflow.

D. Pamp 75 sx CalSeal "Top out Sturry" down annulus.

D. Notify the State of Utah and BLMrepresentatives a minimum of 24 hours prior to the casing job.

E. Check slurry densitywithpressurized mud scales throughout the job.Catch samples of slurry

and dry cement periodically while mixing.

CEMENT TO BE USED MUST BE LABTESTED
PRIOR TO SENDING SAME TO THE I OCATION.

F. Complete PPCO Casíng and Cementing Report(DIMS) and send to the Houston Office,

G. After Cal Seal Plug is set firmly, wait an additional twohours, then cut off casing, install I1" 5M

x 4 1/16" 10M tubing spool.

1.1.3. General Remarks

1. Place markorjointsin the string at 10,500 and 8,500* to assist in
perforating the Mesa Verde.

2. Tie Halliburtondischarge and pumping lines into the BOP stack to

allow mud to route to the pits and to be rigged up to pump the Calseal
Cap. Function test annular to be sure it is holding. Close4 ½" rams or

annalar around casing. Pressure test the nitrogen lines ( 1000 psi over

the calculated "plug bumping pressure). Pressure testcementing lines
to 3000 psi.

3. Usebatch tanks to contain cement prior to pumping downhole.

4. Wash excoss cement out of lines prior to displacement.

5. Release True Drilling Rig No. 30 after installation of tubing spool and
master valve.

TOTAL
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PHILLIPS
PHILLIPS PETROLEUM COMPANY
9780 MT. PYRAMID CT., SlJITE 200
ENGLEWOOD, CO 80112

AMERICAS DIVISION

April 23, 2001

To: Carl Daniels

From: Jan Evans
f-33553

Here is a copy of the weekly updates you have requested to be mailed to you.
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.Apr-24-O1 OS:49A Mark alderston 1- "O 824 1911 P.O2

WELLNAME JOB NUMBER EVENTCODE HMS P OG TMD TVD DFS REPTNO. DATE
FEDERAL 31-29 000001 2 OCM 12,512 12,512 60 1.4 1

SUPERVISOR RIGNAMEA NO. FtELD NAME1000 NO, AUTHMD DMLY TANG OUM.TANG
MarkBalderaton Lead Energy

. l ..,
WILDCAT 12,700.00 .0.00 | 0,00

CURRENTSTATUS ACCIDENTSLABY24 HRs.7 DAILY INT WID MUD CUMINTANG WI MUD
R/D swival and stripping head 12,550,00 1,050,103.14

24 HRFORECAST DATEOF LASTaAFEIY MEGUNG DMLY TOTAL CUMCOSTWI MUD
Drillout plugs 04/15/2001 12,550 1,253,544

LITHO(.OGY JAR HRS OF SERVICE SMA HRB alNGE INSP LEAKOFF AFE AUTH,
SANDSTONE/SHALE 12.51 WAR.BSD.VOO2

. ..

800,993
LASTSURVEY;DATE TMD ING A21- i.AST CAsiNG NEXT CASING LABYBOP PRES TEST

08:30 10:00 1.50 CM T DPio 6 80CMPL R/D Power swivel,annularpremnter and strippinghead. RIOpower tonge.
1090 10:45 0.75 CMT OP10 5 80CMPL R/Upump, reversecirculate20 bbis throughfloat Pump down tbg and caught

pressum.
10:45 14:15 3.50 CM T DP10 4 80CMPL TOOH wl tbgand BHA. Had piece of coment plug (aluminumcore) stuck infloat,

holdingit open.
14:16 14:46 0.50 CM P 4 00CMPL MakeupnewBHA.P/U ononejt and pump throughfloat.Operationpoeluvewitti

pumpflow of 2 BPM and 0 psi.
14:45 17:30 2.75 CM P 4 80CMPL TIH w/ 3-3/4" Smith Rock bit and 2¾" tbg.
17:30 18:30 1.00 CM P 6 80CMPL R/Upowerswivelandpump
18:30 21:00 2.50 CMP h 80CMPL Orition composite bridge plugat9010' KB Release pressure and mm

¯

swivelto 10,034'.Clean wellbom. POOH fo 10,012'. Close in BOP's and Instali
T1Wvalveon tubing,SI weitw/2200 pel on cag.

Ofillingdetalle:

Break circulation w/ 500 poi cag, 300 psi tbg. Begin drilling plug.Break through
topof plug in 8 min. Had increase in flow to pit. Clean and push plug to 10,030'.

Tag 11afd,drBIplugand sand, Pressure increasing from 500 psi on pumpto 1,000

paipumping3% KCL Casing pressum inemasing kom 500 poito 1500psi.

21:00 21:45 0.75 CM P e 80CMPL Set uptestesperator. Load w/ pmasumand set controls and udjust equipment.
21:45 06:00 8,25 CMP u 80cMPL Stad flowingwell throughtest sepamtor.

Si cog press. 3000 pel. Open on a 14/64"chokew/ a instant rate of 2.2 MMCFD.

Sep. poes. 010 psi, sep. temp. 180 deg.

Curmntly11owing at 147,000 cuMir. or a 3.528 MMCFD. Cag press. 1050 psi, on

a 41/04"chol<a.Produced 333 bbis of Water

: 04/23/2001 6:47:21
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Apr-24-o1 OS:5OA Mark iderston 1-9 O 824 1911 P.O3

WEtL NAW JOO NUMBER EVENTCODE N HRSPWOG TMD TD DFB REPT NO, DATE
FEDE RAL 31-29 000001 2 OCM \ 12 512 12 512 40 13 1

$UPERVigon Rio MAME & NO. FIELD NANEI OCS NO. AufM MD DAK.YTANG CUM,TANO
MarkBaldersion Leed Energy WILocAT 12 00.00 0.00 i. 0.00

CURRENTSTATUS ACC10ENTSLAst M une.? DAILY IT WIOMUD QUM INTANG WFMUD
14 538.00 1,037,553.14

24 HRFORECAsf DATEOF i.AST SAFETY MEETala DAILY 1 TAL GUM COST WI MUp
.

Test etsok, TlH, Driltoutplugs 04/15/2001
. ..

N,538 1,240,994
LITHOLOGY JAR HRSOF SERVICE BHA HRS SINCE INsP &F..AWOFF AFE AUTH.

SANDSTONEISHALE | 12.61 WAR.ssD.VOO2
.

800,993
LASTSUAVEY:DATE TMD $NC AžIM t.AST CAnma NEKTCASING LAST BOP PRES TEST

4.500 (In.) g )2,465.6 (it) (in.) g 12,700.0 (ft) 03/27/2001

07:00 08:00 1.00 CMP 6 '.80cMPL Tighten all bolls again.R/Uto test stack.
08 00 11:30 3.50 WC P 6 80CMPL RIUSingle Jack. RIH w/ hanger and bull plug.set hanger and plultup toteet

stack. Test ai components of BOPalack, Iow300 poi,6500 poi high. Charted all
tests. Rio single jeck,

11:30 16:30 5,00 CMP 1 80cMPL Make up BHA, med. taalhrock bit, pump off sub, 1 jt2-3/8", XNnipple,1.875 x
1.791", 1 jt 2.3/8", X nippio 1.875. RiH and tag composlie plugat 9910' KB.Lay

... . .. ...
"A RIN remaining35alds.

16:30 20:30 4.00 CM i 80CMPL R/Uannular,and etrippinghead, R/Upowerswiveland pump. Wait on short
spool, 4-1/2' 10K x 7-1/16" 5K.

20:30 22:30 2.00 CM i 80CMPL R/U pump and load tbg.Caught pressure w/ 38 bbla. Pressure up to3,000 psL
Floatmust be obstructed.Suggeoff pressure. Still plugged. Reverse circulatedat
700 pol. SDFN

CM 80CMPL Kawack R/U test separator and flow IInes. Tied into 400 bbi tank for oli storage
R/Upmpane tobeat unit. Pumped pit water to tanks. Nebaker hauled 17 loads of
pitwatertoDominionpit,

Printe¢ 04/23/2001 6:47:34
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.Apr-24-O1 OS:5OA Mark a lderston 1- ' 824 1911 P.O4

WELLNAMg Jos NUMBER EVE T CODE N HAS PROG TMD TVD DFS REPT NO, DATE
FEDERAL31-29 000001 2 OOM 12,512 02,512 48 1 12

_

_1/2001

SUPERvisoR RIGNAMEA NO FIELDNAMEJ Oos NO. AUTHMD DAILY TANG CUM.TANG
MarkBalderaton Leed Energy WILDCAT 12,700.00 0.00 0.00

CURRENTSTATUS AcciDENTs LAST M HMS.? DAILYINTW MUD CUM INTANG WI MUD
Testing Stack 128,470.00 1,023,015.14

M HRFORECAST DATEOF LAsTBAPUTYMNETINGDAILYTOTAL CUM COSTWfMUD
Test stack, TlH, Dra out pluge

. _ .

04/15/2001 161,161
.

.

1,226,456
LilNOLOGY JAR HRB OF SERVICE BNA HMS SINCE INSP LEAKOFF AFE AUTH.

SANDSTONE/SHALE 12.51 WAR.BSD.VOO2
.

800,993
LAST SURVEY: DATE TMD (NG ARM LAST CASING NEKYCASING LAST BOP PRES TEST

4,500 (In.)g 12,465.5 (ft) (in.) g 12,700.0(ft) 03/27/2001

06:00 08:00 2.00 CMP q 80cMPL TOOHWI WL.RIHand pettorate interval (correlate to OH togs) from 10,014' to
10,019',21 holes. Shot at 4 JSPF, w/ 16 gm charges, 120 deg phasing.0.45"
EHD, and 16" penetration.Allshals fired. TOOH.

W:00 08:30 0.50 CM P q 80CMPL Rig down lubricator. Rig up freo head.
08:30 08:45 0.25 CM P 0 SOCMPLHoldsafetymeetingw/frac crew.
oe:a ao a cú f swas . socu E ¯WaR

on Sand dermy
10:10 12 00 1 83 CM P s 80CMPL Frao zone 7 w/ 90,000 lba of AcFrac PROOOO,and 40,513 gal of 35 ppg Hybor

(includingpad),

Run jobon manual due to computer maffunction. Strap chemicals often. Start w/
3% KCL eqv. water for breakdown. Load w/ 43 bbis. Establish rate of 30 BPM
afterbreakat 7463 pol,Pump a totalof 103 bbl to loadand break down.SD w/
ISIP of 5250 pet (BHFO of 0.96 pel/ft) Walt5 minutes.Prose, declineto 5000
psi. Begin Pad at 30 BPMand 6480 pel w/ 35 ppg Munk Hybor,totalof214 bble of
pad. Beginpropat 1 ppg and ramp to 6 ppg. Pump a totalof 750 bbis of sand
inden fluid. Flushw/144 bbis of Kneargel w/ xlinker and buffer cut, through
x-over at 2 ppg drop in densiometer, ISIP 4000 psi (BHFG 0.90 pal/ft).Net press.
decrease of 590 psi. 5 min 4601 psi. 10 min- 4580 poi, 15 min - 4523 psi, 30 min
4465 psi.

Tolai load to recover: 1212 bble
¾00 17:00 6.00 CM P 1 SOCMPL Open was to tiowbackzone 7 fmo, openon a 16/64"choke at 4200 pol.Flow to

12:25hra on is chaka to3200 psi. Made a traceofsandat bottomsup.Open toe
24/64" choke and flowhem 12:25hra to 13:15 hra to2200 psi. Open to a 32/64"
choke and flowto13:46 his to 850 psi. Open to a 64/64" choke to 17:00 his to
380 pst Est. recovery 534 bbis. Si Welt.

17:00 18:30 1.50 CM P q 80cMPL R/UHaniburtonwiraEne. RIH w/ SK compoeltebridge plugunder grease. set plug
from corellation to OHlogat 9910' KB. TOOH.

18:30 20:30 2.00 CM P 6 80CMPL openwelltopit and blow downpressure. Open cap on toggingadapter, and
pump 140 bbis of3% KCL water toloadcasing.Ran out of water.

20:30 21:30 1.00 CM P e 80CMPL N/D frac toe, andNIU BOP stack. SWIFN

00:00 CM 80CMPL Total Est Load recoveredto date: Zone 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6 and 7; 4799 bbis out of

13,037 bbia (37% recovered)

Prknad 0408/2001 6.47:40
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OMB NO. 1004-0135(August 1999) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires:November30, 2000

BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeaseSerialNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS LÚ L
Do not use this form forprpposals to ddll or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.
O / A

7. If Unit or CA/Agreemmt, Name and/or No.

1. Ty

GausMIT IN TRIPLIrCATE - Otherinstnictions on reverse

NFiDENTIAL = - d No.

2. Name of Operator jg
Phillips Petroleum Company 4 APTWalINn

3a. Address 3b. PhoneNo. (include area code) 3 ("
P.O. Box 1967, Houston, TX 77251-19Ê7 | 7 I $ - ((o Ÿ 3Ë L vi Field and vanior svplar,toryArm
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Nw NE dec.. 29- nŠ ÊI9E
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SubsequentReport ce g Reper New Construction Recomplem O&er
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If the proposal is to deepen directio or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work be performedor providethe Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequentreports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completionor recompletionm a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final AbandonmentNotices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the final site is ready for final inspection.)

14. INhereb c the foregoing is true and correct Title

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERALOR STATE OFFICE USE
Appmved by Title Ñi i

Canditionsof approval, if any, are attached. Approvalof this notice does not warrantot Office [)DJthat the applicant holds legal or equatable title to those rights in the subject -least-
would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. OIL, GAS AND

Title 18 US.C. Section 1001, and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its
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g 9 CONFllEN11AL
PHILLIPS PETROLEUMCO Page 1 of a

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FEDERAL 31-29 000001
Common Well Name: FEDERAL 31-29 000001 Spud Date: 02/28/2001
Event Name: Original Drilling Start: 01/22/2001 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Code Subco Phase Descriptionof Operations

01/19/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 DR 1 05C1DR MIRU Leon Ross rathole rig.HSM Drilled 90' of 17-1/2" hole. SDFN
01/20/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 DR 1 05C1DR Drilled 90' of 17-1/2" hole. SDFN
01/21/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 DR 1 05C1DR Drillied 42' of 17-1/2" hole, for a totaldepth of 222' GL. POOH. LD 8-1/2"

DP and 17-1/2" bit. SDFN.
01/22/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 CS 1 05C1RC Prep to runcsing. P/U and RIH with 13-3/8" GS, SJt, Baffle Plate, and 4 jts

of 13-3/8"
, 48#, H-40 casing. R/U Halliburton. HSM. Cment conductorw/

260 sks class "G", + 3% CaCI. Pump 25 bbis of water, 20 bbis of gel water,
260 sks of cement, and displace w/ 28 bbis of water. Plug down at 14:30
hrs. Ciculated 10 bbis of cment to surface. Close in valve on head. R/D
Halliburton. Drilled 17-1/2" rathole and mouse hole. SDFN

01/23/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 DR 6 05C1RC Install cellarring.RDMO Leon Ross rathole dg.
02/27/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 MV 1 00MMIR BLMnotilled on 2-16-01 of rig move, called Ed Forsman at Vernal Office.

Begin mob on 2/19/01. Begin riggingup on 2/22/01. Nelco modifiedpit to
accomodate rlg. Used cat to pull In trucks. Nebeker hauling water to pit.
Surface casing delivered toJ&R construction'syard in Rosevelt. Delivered
trailerhouse, water, sewer,trashbaskets, chemical toilets,mud motors,
shock subs, fork lift,gas buster, super choke, and 13-3/8" cutoff for flow
nipple.

Called In spud noticeto Ed Forsman w/ BLM, and Gilbert Hunter w/ State
of Utah at 4:00 pm Monday, February 26, 2001.

02/28/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 DR 1 00MMIR Rigging up True #30. Filltanksand make repairs. Install flow nipple and rig
up flowline. P/U Kelly and service. Repair rathole sleave.

Hold safety meetings w/all crews.
03/01/2001 06:00 - 13:00 7.00 DR 1 00MMIR P/U 12.25" bit, BHA. Prep to spud. BHA: Bit, MM, SS, 3 - 8" collars,6-1/4"

collars.Tag cement at 192' KB.
13:00 - 03:00 14.00 DR 1 10C2DR Spud wellat 13:00 hrs, 2-28-01. Drill54' of cement at slow rate until 8"

collarsare below conductor casing. At 368' picked up speed. Run MMat
115 rpm,and table at 60 rpm. Pumps at 100 spm ea, for 698 gpm, w/ pp at
2000 psi.

03:00 - 03:30 0.50 DR b 10C2DR Survey
03:30 - 06:00 2.50 DR 1 10C2DR Ddtling

03/02/2001 06:00 - 13:00 7.00 DR 1 10C2DR Ddll 12-1/4" hole
13:00 - 13:30 0.50 DR b 10C2DR Survey
13:30 - 14:00 0.50 RM 3 10C2DR Rig service
14:00 - 14:30 0.50 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 RM 3 10C2DR Work on Rig
15:00 - 00:00 9.00 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole
00:00 - 00:30 0.50 DR b 10C2DR Survey
00:30 -06:00 5.50 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole

03/03/2001 06:00 -09:30 3.50 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole
09:30 - 10:00 0.50 DR b 10C2DR Surveyat 2002'
10:00 - 16:00 6.00 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4' hole
16:00 - 16:30 0.50 RM 3 10C2DR Rig Service
16:30 - 22:30 6.00 DR 1 10C2DR Dilli 12-1/4" hole
22:30 - 23:00 0.50 DR b 10C2DR Surveyat 2502'
23:00 - 06:00 7.00 DR 1 10C2DR Ddil 12-1/4" hole

03/04/2001 06:00 - 07:30 1.50 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole
07:30 - 08:00 0.50 RM 3 10C2DR RigService
08:00 - 11:30 3.50 DR 1 10C2DR Ddil 12-1/4" hole
11:30 - 12:00 0.50 DR b 10C2DR Survey2966
12:00 - 00:30 12.50 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole

Printed: 03/08/2001 9:12:39
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FEDERAL 31-29 000001
Common Well Name: FEDERAL 31-29 000001 Spud Date: 02/28/2001
Event Name; Original Drilling Start: 01/22/2001 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours ÒodeŠdbcoPhase bescriptionofOgánóns

03/04/2001 00:30 - 03:30 3.00 DR 1 10C2DR Run ploymer sweeps to clean hole. DrlllingIlke fractured shale. Unloaded
good slug of cuttings,shaker full. Still willnot drill.

03:30 - 06:00 2.50 DR 4 10C2DR TOOH w/ bit.

Notify Ed Forsman w/ BLM,for surface cementing.
11:30 am 3/3/01

03/05/2001 06:00 - 06:30 0.50 DR 4 05C1DR Trip for bit
06:30 -07:00 0.50 DR 4 05C1DR Break out bit #1, P/U bit #2
07:00 - 11:00 4.00 DR 4 10C2DR RIH w/ bit #2
11:00 - 12:30 1.50 DR 10C2DR Ream 154' back to bottom. Hole out of guage.
12:30 - 17:30 5.00 DR 1 10C2DR Resume drilling at 3266'. 12-1/4" surface hole.
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 RM 3 10C2DR Rig Service.
18:00 - 22:00 4.00 DR 1 10C2DR Drilling12-1/4" surface hole.
22:00 - 22:30 0.50 DR 1 10C2DR Reach totaldepth of 3540'. Sweep hole. Pump gel pill,drop survey,
22:30 - 00:00 1.50 DR 5 10C2DR Circulate and conditionhole. Spot gel plli.
00:00 - 02:30 2.50 CS 6 10C2DR TOOH withdrillstring. R/U Mountain States Casing Service. Lay down 8"

collars.
02:30 - 06:00 3.50 CS 1 10C2DR R/U casing tools.P/U and run 9-5/8", 40#, J-55, LT&C.

Notified Ed Forsman w/ BLMOf current schedule for surface casing and
cementing,at 7:15 pm, 3-4-01.

03/06/2001 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 CS 4 10C2RC Running 9-5/8" surface casing.
07:00 - 07:30 0.50 CS 1 10C2RC Fillcasing
07:30 - 09:30 2.00 CS 10C2RC Running casing. Tag bottom at 3571'. Hole deeper thanSLM of drill string.

both talliescoralated. There had to have been an extra jointdrilled, or there
was 31' of make up. Alltrips correlated to jt count and tallysheet. AIIjoints
were marked and counted for all tubulars.

09:30 - 10:30 1.00 CE 6 10C2RC R/U Halliburton.
10:30 - 11:30 1.00 CE 5 10C2RC Circulate and conditionhole.
11:30 - 11:45 0.25 CE O 10C2RC Held safety meetingwithCementing crewand rig crew. discussed roles

and responsibilities,andsafe practices for this job.
11:45 - 13:30 1.75 CE 1 10C2DR Cement surface casing as follows: pump 20 bbis of Super Flush and 25 bbi

spacer. Mixand pump 465 sks lead (238 bbis) at 12 ppg, 2.87 cuft/sk,15.5
gal/skwater of HI-FIIILead cement, containgclass G, 6% EX-1, 1% HR-7,
3% salt, and 10 lb/sk glisonite.Followed by 360 sks tall (74 bbis) at (first
200 sks at 14.8 ppg due to problem with truck)15.8 ppg, 1.16 cuft/sk,5.16
gal/sack water, containgclass G , 2% CaC; and 1/4 ppsk poly-e-flake.
Displace with265 bbis of water from mud system. Had retums throughout
job withperiods of reduced to lost circulationfor last 100 bbis of
displacement.

13:30 - 15:30 2.00 CE 1 10C2RC WOC. Rig up one Inch to top out. Run in withone Inch tubing.Could not
get past collarat 130'.

15:30 - 16:30 1.00 CE 1 10C2RC Mix and pumptwo stages of 10 bbis each of class G, w/ 3% CaCI, for a
total of 100 sks. Had retums of lead slurry, rightawaywhen pumping. Had
slow falling columnafterfirst plug.Wait 15 minutes. Raised columnto bell
nipple.Shut down and watched fall. Cement holding, had to dump 5 bbis to
pit.Used a total of75 sks In annulus. Approved by BLM.

16:30 - 16:31 0.02 CE z 10C2RC Cement Job witnessed by Raymond Amold w/ BLM.
16:31 - 19:00 2.48 CE 6 10C2RC R/D Halliburton. WOC
19:00 - 23:00 4.00 WO j 10C2RC WOC
23:00 - 01:00 2.00 DR 1 10C2RC Make first cut on riser. Rough cut 9-5/8" surface casing.
01:00 - 06:00 5.00 CS e 10C2RC Weld on 9-5/8"

, 5000 psl casing head. Let cooland test.
03/07/2001 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 CS 2 10C2RC Weld on casing head. Let cool, then test. Had leaking weld on inside.

Printed: 03/08/2001 9:12:39
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FEDERAL 31-29 000001
Common Well Name: FEDERAL 31-29 000001 Spud Date: 02/28/2001
Event Name; Original Drilling Start: 01/22/2001 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours ÒodeŠdbcoPhase bescriptionofOgánóns

03/04/2001 00:30 - 03:30 3.00 DR 1 10C2DR Run ploymer sweeps to clean hole. DrlllingIlke fractured shale. Unloaded
good slug of cuttings,shaker full. Still willnot drill.

03:30 - 06:00 2.50 DR 4 10C2DR TOOH w/ bit.

Notify Ed Forsman w/ BLM,for surface cementing.
11:30 am 3/3/01

03/05/2001 06:00 - 06:30 0.50 DR 4 05C1DR Trip for bit
06:30 -07:00 0.50 DR 4 05C1DR Break out bit #1, P/U bit #2
07:00 - 11:00 4.00 DR 4 10C2DR RIH w/ bit #2
11:00 - 12:30 1.50 DR 10C2DR Ream 154' back to bottom. Hole out of guage.
12:30 - 17:30 5.00 DR 1 10C2DR Resume drilling at 3266'. 12-1/4" surface hole.
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 RM 3 10C2DR Rig Service.
18:00 - 22:00 4.00 DR 1 10C2DR Drilling12-1/4" surface hole.
22:00 - 22:30 0.50 DR 1 10C2DR Reach totaldepth of 3540'. Sweep hole. Pump gel pill,drop survey,
22:30 - 00:00 1.50 DR 5 10C2DR Circulate and conditionhole. Spot gel plli.
00:00 - 02:30 2.50 CS 6 10C2DR TOOH withdrillstring. R/U Mountain States Casing Service. Lay down 8"

collars.
02:30 - 06:00 3.50 CS 1 10C2DR R/U casing tools.P/U and run 9-5/8", 40#, J-55, LT&C.

Notified Ed Forsman w/ BLMOf current schedule for surface casing and
cementing,at 7:15 pm, 3-4-01.

03/06/2001 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 CS 4 10C2RC Running 9-5/8" surface casing.
07:00 - 07:30 0.50 CS 1 10C2RC Fillcasing
07:30 - 09:30 2.00 CS 10C2RC Running casing. Tag bottom at 3571'. Hole deeper thanSLM of drill string.

both talliescoralated. There had to have been an extra jointdrilled, or there
was 31' of make up. Alltrips correlated to jt count and tallysheet. AIIjoints
were marked and counted for all tubulars.
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Legal Well Name: FEDERAL 31-29 000001
Common Well Name: FEDERAL 31-29 000001 Spud Date: 02/28/2001
Event Name: Original Drilling Start: 01/22/2001 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date f( ni- To Hours 90de Subco base escript i1AfÓperations

03/07/2001 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 CS 2 10C2RC Attempted to fix two more times withall falling. Walt on welder.
10:30 - 11:00 0.50 WO 0 10C2RC Jim Weaver held safety meeting withdaylight crew. Discussed Phillips

Safety program and expectations.
11:00 - 14:30 3.50 WO u 10C2RC Wait on welder,and new casing head.
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 WO 0 10C2RC Jim Weaver held safety meeting withdaylight crew. Discussed Phillips

Safety program and expectations.
15:00 - 16:00 1.00 WO u 10C2RC Walton welder, and newcasing head.
16:00 - 22:00 6.00 CS e 10C2RC J&R welder on location. Cutoffcasing head. Dress offand bevel casing.

Heat new wellhead and install. Let cool.
22:00 - 22:30 0.50 CS 8 10C2RC R/U Single Jack Testers, and testedweldon casing head. all passed
22:30 - 23:00 0.50 WO 0 10C2RC Jim Weaver held safety meeting with daylight crew. Discussed Phillips

Safety pogram and expectations.
23:00 - 06:00 7.00 DR 6 20SFDR N/U BOP stack.

03/08/2001 06:00 - 06:01 0.02 Have verbal approval from BLMfor change in hole size and production
casing from APD. Approved by Ed Forsman ,BLM Engineer, Vemal office
on 3/5/01.

06:01 - 14:30 8.48 WC 2 05C1EV N/U BOP's.
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 WC 6 05C1EV Hookup IInes to accumulator.
15:00 - 16:00 1.00 WC 6 05C1EV Change out lines to BOP.
16:00 - 02:00 10.00 WC 8 05C1EV Perform Stack Test and casing. AIIpassed. Accumulator test falled.

Annular valve stuck open, had to repair.
02:00 - 06:00 4.00 WC 05C1EV P/U BHA. Mud 7-7/8" bit, motor,float sub, 24 - 6-1/4" drill collars. RIH w/

drill pipe.

Pdnted: 03/08/2001 9:12:39
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Form 3160-5 UN STATES FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) DEPARTME OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 10044)135

Expires:Novembe:SO, 2000
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeaseSerialNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLs UTu '7to2.l'a2.
Do not use this form for proposals to drillor to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Fonn 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No

1. T

S(IBMITIN TRIPUCATE - Other Instmellons on reverse d

8. Well

am/e

and No.

2. Name of Operator Of ÑAL
Phillips Petroleum Company 9. APIwellNo.

3a. Address 3b. PhoneNo. (include area code) 3 /" 2
P.O. Box 1967. Houston, TX 77251-1967 j 10 FieldandPool,orExploratoryArea

4. IncationofWell(Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or SurveyDescription)
(oS2' PNL ./ 2CY2.'FEL ¿p-dý -33K3 /AÜdAT
Nw NE Sec.. 27 - TŸ/ - / Ÿf 11. County or Parish, State

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATE NATUREOFNOTICE,REPORT,OROTHERDATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent Acidize Deepo Producdon (San/Rm) Water Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Rechmadon Weluntegruy
SubsequentReport

Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

O Final Abandonment Notice Change Phns Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon

O co-----son O rinsa. O w-assosai

13. Describe Proposed or Coommyle tion (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated startingdate of any proposed work and approximateduration thereof.
If the poposal is to deepen airec or mcomplete horizontally, give subsurface locationsand measuredand true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work be performed or ÿrovidethe Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequentreports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completionor recompletionm a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final AbandonmentNotices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the final site is ready for final inspection.)

AloT7CE OF SPup

DIVISION OF
OIL. GAS AND L G

14. INherebc e foregoingis true and correct Title

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATEOFFICE USE
Approved by Title Ditte

äkiM3Ïig&iiÏ~iny¯¯¼¯ALÃÊ
Approvalof this notice does not warrantot Office

cernfy that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
whien would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Tide 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the United
States any false,fictitious or fraudulent statements or representationsas to any matter within its
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g 9 CONFllEN11AL
PHILLIPS PETROLEUMCO Page 1 of a

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FEDERAL 31-29 000001
Common Well Name: FEDERAL 31-29 000001 Spud Date: 02/28/2001
Event Name: Original Drilling Start: 01/22/2001 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Code Subco Phase Descriptionof Operations

01/19/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 DR 1 05C1DR MIRU Leon Ross rathole rig.HSM Drilled 90' of 17-1/2" hole. SDFN
01/20/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 DR 1 05C1DR Drilled 90' of 17-1/2" hole. SDFN
01/21/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 DR 1 05C1DR Drillied 42' of 17-1/2" hole, for a totaldepth of 222' GL. POOH. LD 8-1/2"

DP and 17-1/2" bit. SDFN.
01/22/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 CS 1 05C1RC Prep to runcsing. P/U and RIH with 13-3/8" GS, SJt, Baffle Plate, and 4 jts

of 13-3/8"
, 48#, H-40 casing. R/U Halliburton. HSM. Cment conductorw/

260 sks class "G", + 3% CaCI. Pump 25 bbis of water, 20 bbis of gel water,
260 sks of cement, and displace w/ 28 bbis of water. Plug down at 14:30
hrs. Ciculated 10 bbis of cment to surface. Close in valve on head. R/D
Halliburton. Drilled 17-1/2" rathole and mouse hole. SDFN

01/23/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 DR 6 05C1RC Install cellarring.RDMO Leon Ross rathole dg.
02/27/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 MV 1 00MMIR BLMnotilled on 2-16-01 of rig move, called Ed Forsman at Vernal Office.

Begin mob on 2/19/01. Begin riggingup on 2/22/01. Nelco modifiedpit to
accomodate rlg. Used cat to pull In trucks. Nebeker hauling water to pit.
Surface casing delivered toJ&R construction'syard in Rosevelt. Delivered
trailerhouse, water, sewer,trashbaskets, chemical toilets,mud motors,
shock subs, fork lift,gas buster, super choke, and 13-3/8" cutoff for flow
nipple.

Called In spud noticeto Ed Forsman w/ BLM, and Gilbert Hunter w/ State
of Utah at 4:00 pm Monday, February 26, 2001.

02/28/2001 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 DR 1 00MMIR Rigging up True #30. Filltanksand make repairs. Install flow nipple and rig
up flowline. P/U Kelly and service. Repair rathole sleave.

Hold safety meetings w/all crews.
03/01/2001 06:00 - 13:00 7.00 DR 1 00MMIR P/U 12.25" bit, BHA. Prep to spud. BHA: Bit, MM, SS, 3 - 8" collars,6-1/4"

collars.Tag cement at 192' KB.
13:00 - 03:00 14.00 DR 1 10C2DR Spud wellat 13:00 hrs, 2-28-01. Drill54' of cement at slow rate until 8"

collarsare below conductor casing. At 368' picked up speed. Run MMat
115 rpm,and table at 60 rpm. Pumps at 100 spm ea, for 698 gpm, w/ pp at
2000 psi.

03:00 - 03:30 0.50 DR b 10C2DR Survey
03:30 - 06:00 2.50 DR 1 10C2DR Ddtling

03/02/2001 06:00 - 13:00 7.00 DR 1 10C2DR Ddll 12-1/4" hole
13:00 - 13:30 0.50 DR b 10C2DR Survey
13:30 - 14:00 0.50 RM 3 10C2DR Rig service
14:00 - 14:30 0.50 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 RM 3 10C2DR Work on Rig
15:00 - 00:00 9.00 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole
00:00 - 00:30 0.50 DR b 10C2DR Survey
00:30 -06:00 5.50 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole

03/03/2001 06:00 -09:30 3.50 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole
09:30 - 10:00 0.50 DR b 10C2DR Surveyat 2002'
10:00 - 16:00 6.00 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4' hole
16:00 - 16:30 0.50 RM 3 10C2DR Rig Service
16:30 - 22:30 6.00 DR 1 10C2DR Dilli 12-1/4" hole
22:30 - 23:00 0.50 DR b 10C2DR Surveyat 2502'
23:00 - 06:00 7.00 DR 1 10C2DR Ddil 12-1/4" hole

03/04/2001 06:00 - 07:30 1.50 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole
07:30 - 08:00 0.50 RM 3 10C2DR RigService
08:00 - 11:30 3.50 DR 1 10C2DR Ddil 12-1/4" hole
11:30 - 12:00 0.50 DR b 10C2DR Survey2966
12:00 - 00:30 12.50 DR 1 10C2DR Drill12-1/4" hole

Printed: 03/08/2001 9:12:39
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Legal Well Name: FEDERAL 31-29 000001
Common Well Name: FEDERAL 31-29 000001 Spud Date: 02/28/2001
Event Name; Original Drilling Start: 01/22/2001 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours ÒodeŠdbcoPhase bescriptionofOgánóns

03/04/2001 00:30 - 03:30 3.00 DR 1 10C2DR Run ploymer sweeps to clean hole. DrlllingIlke fractured shale. Unloaded
good slug of cuttings,shaker full. Still willnot drill.

03:30 - 06:00 2.50 DR 4 10C2DR TOOH w/ bit.

Notify Ed Forsman w/ BLM,for surface cementing.
11:30 am 3/3/01

03/05/2001 06:00 - 06:30 0.50 DR 4 05C1DR Trip for bit
06:30 -07:00 0.50 DR 4 05C1DR Break out bit #1, P/U bit #2
07:00 - 11:00 4.00 DR 4 10C2DR RIH w/ bit #2
11:00 - 12:30 1.50 DR 10C2DR Ream 154' back to bottom. Hole out of guage.
12:30 - 17:30 5.00 DR 1 10C2DR Resume drilling at 3266'. 12-1/4" surface hole.
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 RM 3 10C2DR Rig Service.
18:00 - 22:00 4.00 DR 1 10C2DR Drilling12-1/4" surface hole.
22:00 - 22:30 0.50 DR 1 10C2DR Reach totaldepth of 3540'. Sweep hole. Pump gel pill,drop survey,
22:30 - 00:00 1.50 DR 5 10C2DR Circulate and conditionhole. Spot gel plli.
00:00 - 02:30 2.50 CS 6 10C2DR TOOH withdrillstring. R/U Mountain States Casing Service. Lay down 8"

collars.
02:30 - 06:00 3.50 CS 1 10C2DR R/U casing tools.P/U and run 9-5/8", 40#, J-55, LT&C.

Notified Ed Forsman w/ BLMOf current schedule for surface casing and
cementing,at 7:15 pm, 3-4-01.

03/06/2001 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 CS 4 10C2RC Running 9-5/8" surface casing.
07:00 - 07:30 0.50 CS 1 10C2RC Fillcasing
07:30 - 09:30 2.00 CS 10C2RC Running casing. Tag bottom at 3571'. Hole deeper thanSLM of drill string.

both talliescoralated. There had to have been an extra jointdrilled, or there
was 31' of make up. Alltrips correlated to jt count and tallysheet. AIIjoints
were marked and counted for all tubulars.

09:30 - 10:30 1.00 CE 6 10C2RC R/U Halliburton.
10:30 - 11:30 1.00 CE 5 10C2RC Circulate and conditionhole.
11:30 - 11:45 0.25 CE O 10C2RC Held safety meetingwithCementing crewand rig crew. discussed roles

and responsibilities,andsafe practices for this job.
11:45 - 13:30 1.75 CE 1 10C2DR Cement surface casing as follows: pump 20 bbis of Super Flush and 25 bbi

spacer. Mixand pump 465 sks lead (238 bbis) at 12 ppg, 2.87 cuft/sk,15.5
gal/skwater of HI-FIIILead cement, containgclass G, 6% EX-1, 1% HR-7,
3% salt, and 10 lb/sk glisonite.Followed by 360 sks tall (74 bbis) at (first
200 sks at 14.8 ppg due to problem with truck)15.8 ppg, 1.16 cuft/sk,5.16
gal/sack water, containgclass G , 2% CaC; and 1/4 ppsk poly-e-flake.
Displace with265 bbis of water from mud system. Had retums throughout
job withperiods of reduced to lost circulationfor last 100 bbis of
displacement.

13:30 - 15:30 2.00 CE 1 10C2RC WOC. Rig up one Inch to top out. Run in withone Inch tubing.Could not
get past collarat 130'.

15:30 - 16:30 1.00 CE 1 10C2RC Mix and pumptwo stages of 10 bbis each of class G, w/ 3% CaCI, for a
total of 100 sks. Had retums of lead slurry, rightawaywhen pumping. Had
slow falling columnafterfirst plug.Wait 15 minutes. Raised columnto bell
nipple.Shut down and watched fall. Cement holding, had to dump 5 bbis to
pit.Used a total of75 sks In annulus. Approved by BLM.

16:30 - 16:31 0.02 CE z 10C2RC Cement Job witnessed by Raymond Amold w/ BLM.
16:31 - 19:00 2.48 CE 6 10C2RC R/D Halliburton. WOC
19:00 - 23:00 4.00 WO j 10C2RC WOC
23:00 - 01:00 2.00 DR 1 10C2RC Make first cut on riser. Rough cut 9-5/8" surface casing.
01:00 - 06:00 5.00 CS e 10C2RC Weld on 9-5/8"

, 5000 psl casing head. Let cooland test.
03/07/2001 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 CS 2 10C2RC Weld on casing head. Let cool, then test. Had leaking weld on inside.

Printed: 03/08/2001 9:12:39
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Notify Ed Forsman w/ BLM,for surface cementing.
11:30 am 3/3/01

03/05/2001 06:00 - 06:30 0.50 DR 4 05C1DR Trip for bit
06:30 -07:00 0.50 DR 4 05C1DR Break out bit #1, P/U bit #2
07:00 - 11:00 4.00 DR 4 10C2DR RIH w/ bit #2
11:00 - 12:30 1.50 DR 10C2DR Ream 154' back to bottom. Hole out of guage.
12:30 - 17:30 5.00 DR 1 10C2DR Resume drilling at 3266'. 12-1/4" surface hole.
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 RM 3 10C2DR Rig Service.
18:00 - 22:00 4.00 DR 1 10C2DR Drilling12-1/4" surface hole.
22:00 - 22:30 0.50 DR 1 10C2DR Reach totaldepth of 3540'. Sweep hole. Pump gel pill,drop survey,
22:30 - 00:00 1.50 DR 5 10C2DR Circulate and conditionhole. Spot gel plli.
00:00 - 02:30 2.50 CS 6 10C2DR TOOH withdrillstring. R/U Mountain States Casing Service. Lay down 8"

collars.
02:30 - 06:00 3.50 CS 1 10C2DR R/U casing tools.P/U and run 9-5/8", 40#, J-55, LT&C.

Notified Ed Forsman w/ BLMOf current schedule for surface casing and
cementing,at 7:15 pm, 3-4-01.

03/06/2001 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 CS 4 10C2RC Running 9-5/8" surface casing.
07:00 - 07:30 0.50 CS 1 10C2RC Fillcasing
07:30 - 09:30 2.00 CS 10C2RC Running casing. Tag bottom at 3571'. Hole deeper thanSLM of drill string.

both talliescoralated. There had to have been an extra jointdrilled, or there
was 31' of make up. Alltrips correlated to jt count and tallysheet. AIIjoints
were marked and counted for all tubulars.

09:30 - 10:30 1.00 CE 6 10C2RC R/U Halliburton.
10:30 - 11:30 1.00 CE 5 10C2RC Circulate and conditionhole.
11:30 - 11:45 0.25 CE O 10C2RC Held safety meetingwithCementing crewand rig crew. discussed roles

and responsibilities,andsafe practices for this job.
11:45 - 13:30 1.75 CE 1 10C2DR Cement surface casing as follows: pump 20 bbis of Super Flush and 25 bbi

spacer. Mixand pump 465 sks lead (238 bbis) at 12 ppg, 2.87 cuft/sk,15.5
gal/skwater of HI-FIIILead cement, containgclass G, 6% EX-1, 1% HR-7,
3% salt, and 10 lb/sk glisonite.Followed by 360 sks tall (74 bbis) at (first
200 sks at 14.8 ppg due to problem with truck)15.8 ppg, 1.16 cuft/sk,5.16
gal/sack water, containgclass G , 2% CaC; and 1/4 ppsk poly-e-flake.
Displace with265 bbis of water from mud system. Had retums throughout
job withperiods of reduced to lost circulationfor last 100 bbis of
displacement.

13:30 - 15:30 2.00 CE 1 10C2RC WOC. Rig up one Inch to top out. Run in withone Inch tubing.Could not
get past collarat 130'.

15:30 - 16:30 1.00 CE 1 10C2RC Mix and pumptwo stages of 10 bbis each of class G, w/ 3% CaCI, for a
total of 100 sks. Had retums of lead slurry, rightawaywhen pumping. Had
slow falling columnafterfirst plug.Wait 15 minutes. Raised columnto bell
nipple.Shut down and watched fall. Cement holding, had to dump 5 bbis to
pit.Used a total of75 sks In annulus. Approved by BLM.

16:30 - 16:31 0.02 CE z 10C2RC Cement Job witnessed by Raymond Amold w/ BLM.
16:31 - 19:00 2.48 CE 6 10C2RC R/D Halliburton. WOC
19:00 - 23:00 4.00 WO j 10C2RC WOC
23:00 - 01:00 2.00 DR 1 10C2RC Make first cut on riser. Rough cut 9-5/8" surface casing.
01:00 - 06:00 5.00 CS e 10C2RC Weld on 9-5/8"

, 5000 psl casing head. Let cooland test.
03/07/2001 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 CS 2 10C2RC Weld on casing head. Let cool, then test. Had leaking weld on inside.

Printed: 03/08/2001 9:12:39
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Operatiqns Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FEDERAL 31-29 000001
Common Well Name: FEDERAL 31-29 000001 Spud Date: 02/28/2001
Event Name: Original Drilling Start: 01/22/2001 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date f( ni- To Hours 90de Subco base escript i1AfÓperations

03/07/2001 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 CS 2 10C2RC Attempted to fix two more times withall falling. Walt on welder.
10:30 - 11:00 0.50 WO 0 10C2RC Jim Weaver held safety meeting withdaylight crew. Discussed Phillips

Safety program and expectations.
11:00 - 14:30 3.50 WO u 10C2RC Wait on welder,and new casing head.
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 WO 0 10C2RC Jim Weaver held safety meeting withdaylight crew. Discussed Phillips

Safety program and expectations.
15:00 - 16:00 1.00 WO u 10C2RC Walton welder, and newcasing head.
16:00 - 22:00 6.00 CS e 10C2RC J&R welder on location. Cutoffcasing head. Dress offand bevel casing.

Heat new wellhead and install. Let cool.
22:00 - 22:30 0.50 CS 8 10C2RC R/U Single Jack Testers, and testedweldon casing head. all passed
22:30 - 23:00 0.50 WO 0 10C2RC Jim Weaver held safety meeting with daylight crew. Discussed Phillips

Safety pogram and expectations.
23:00 - 06:00 7.00 DR 6 20SFDR N/U BOP stack.

03/08/2001 06:00 - 06:01 0.02 Have verbal approval from BLMfor change in hole size and production
casing from APD. Approved by Ed Forsman ,BLM Engineer, Vemal office
on 3/5/01.

06:01 - 14:30 8.48 WC 2 05C1EV N/U BOP's.
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 WC 6 05C1EV Hookup IInes to accumulator.
15:00 - 16:00 1.00 WC 6 05C1EV Change out lines to BOP.
16:00 - 02:00 10.00 WC 8 05C1EV Perform Stack Test and casing. AIIpassed. Accumulator test falled.

Annular valve stuck open, had to repair.
02:00 - 06:00 4.00 WC 05C1EV P/U BHA. Mud 7-7/8" bit, motor,float sub, 24 - 6-1/4" drill collars. RIH w/

drill pipe.

Pdnted: 03/08/2001 9:12:39
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Form 3160-5 UN STATES FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) DEPARTME OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 10044)135

Expires:Novembe:SO, 2000
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeaseSerialNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLs UTu '7to2.l'a2.
Do not use this form for proposals to drillor to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Fonn 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No

1. T

S(IBMITIN TRIPUCATE - Other Instmellons on reverse d

8. Well

am/e

and No.

2. Name of Operator Of ÑAL
Phillips Petroleum Company 9. APIwellNo.

3a. Address 3b. PhoneNo. (include area code) 3 /" 2
P.O. Box 1967. Houston, TX 77251-1967 j 10 FieldandPool,orExploratoryArea

4. IncationofWell(Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or SurveyDescription)
(oS2' PNL ./ 2CY2.'FEL ¿p-dý -33K3 /AÜdAT
Nw NE Sec.. 27 - TŸ/ - / Ÿf 11. County or Parish, State

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATE NATUREOFNOTICE,REPORT,OROTHERDATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent Acidize Deepo Producdon (San/Rm) Water Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Rechmadon Weluntegruy
SubsequentReport

Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

O Final Abandonment Notice Change Phns Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon

O co-----son O rinsa. O w-assosai

13. Describe Proposed or Coommyle tion (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated startingdate of any proposed work and approximateduration thereof.
If the poposal is to deepen airec or mcomplete horizontally, give subsurface locationsand measuredand true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work be performed or ÿrovidethe Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequentreports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completionor recompletionm a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final AbandonmentNotices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the final site is ready for final inspection.)

AloT7CE OF SPup

DIVISION OF
OIL. GAS AND L G

14. INherebc e foregoingis true and correct Title

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATEOFFICE USE
Approved by Title Ditte

äkiM3Ïig&iiÏ~iny¯¯¼¯ALÃÊ
Approvalof this notice does not warrantot Office

cernfy that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
whien would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Tide 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the United
States any false,fictitious or fraudulent statements or representationsas to any matter within its
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PillulPs PHILLIPS PETROLEUM COMPANY
9780 Mt. Pyramid Ct., Suite 200
Englewood, Colorado 80112

January 3, 2002

Completion Report
Federal Well 24-7 No. 1 and
Federal Well 31-29 No. 1

Carol Daniels
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Dear Ms. Daniels:

Phillips Petroleum Company (Phillips) respectfully submits Completion Reports
(Form 3160-4) for Federal Well 24-7 No. 1 and Federal Well 31-29 No.1.

Should you have questions or require additionalinformation, please callme at
303-643-3950.

Sincerely,

Cathi Boles
HES Clerk
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303-643-3950.

Sincerely,

Cathi Boles
HES Clerk



00NFIDEL
Form 3160-4 UNITEDSTATES FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000

WELL GOMPLETIONOR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG 5. LeaseSerialNo.
UTU-76262

la. Type of Well O Oil Well E Gas Well O Dry O Other 6, If Indian,Allottee or Tribe Name

b. Type of Completion @ New Well O Work Over O Deepen 0 Plug Back O Diff Resvr.

Other 7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Contact: CATHIBOLES
. .. .. ...

8. LeaseName and WellNo.
PHILLIPSPETROLEUMCOMPANY E-Mâil:"caboles@ppco.com '"a FEDERAL31-29 NO. 1

3. Address 9780 MT.PYRAMIDCT., SUITE 200 i 3a. Phone No. (includearea code) 19.API WellNo.
ENGLEWOOD,CO 80112 Ph: 303.643.3950 Fx: 303.643.4378 43-047-33653

4. Location of Well(Reportlocationclearlyand in accordance with Federal requir DENTIAL 0. Field and Pool,or Exploratory
PER100 witocAT

At surface NENW682FNL 2042FEL ' E PlRED \ l. Sec.,T., R., M,, or Blockand Survey

At top prod intervalreported below NENW682FNL 2042FEL or Area Sec 29 T9S R19E Mer UBM
2. Countyor Parish 13. State

At total depth NENW 682FNL 2042FEL UINTÁH UT

14. DateSpudded 15. DateT.D. Reached 16. Date Completed
,

a 17. Elevations (DF, KB, RT, GL)*
01/18/2001 04/04/2001 OD & A - Ready to Prod" 4846 KB

05/17/2001
18. Total Depth: MD 12512 19. PlugBackT.D.: MD /?/Of 20. Del th Bridge Plug Set: MD

TVD 12512 TVD /g/g TVD

21. ectric& ical Logs Run (Submit copy of each) 22. Waswell cored7 O No O Yes (Submitanalysis)
MDL N CBLIG Was DST run? O No O Yes (Submitanalysis)

// JCL / Directional Survey? No O Yes (Submitanalysis)

23. Casingand LinerRecord (Reportall stringtset in well)

Hole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#/ft.) Top Bottom StageCementer No. of Sks. & Slurry Vol CasingTop* Amount Pulled
(MD) (MD) Depth Type of Cement (BBL)

7.875 4.500 P-110 13.500 22 12465 3058 908 0
12.250 9.625 K-55 40.000 23 3540 825 312 0
17.500 13.375 H-40 48.000 24 222 260 0

24. TubingRecord

Size DepthSet (MD) PackerDepth(MD) Size Depth Set (MD) PackerDepth (MD) Size Depthset(MD) PackerDepth(MD)

2.375 12055
25. Producing Intervals 26. PerforationRecord

Forrnation Top Bottom PerforatedInterval Size No. Holes Perf.Status
A) MESAVERDE 10014 12060 10014 TO 12060 0.450 264
B)
C)
D)
27. Acid, Fracture,Treatment,CementScueeze, Etc.

Depth Interval Amourat and Typeof Material
10014 TO 12060 FRAC STIMULATEWI ACFRAC PR 6000 AND 35PPG HYBOR

28. Production - Interval A
Date Pirst Test Hosts Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas ProductionMethad
Produced Dale Tesied Production BBL MCF BBL Cort. API Oravity

05/17/2001 05/17/2001 24 1320.0 . $1.0 FLOWS FROM WELL

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas:Oil Wet!Status
Size F1ws. 350 Prem. Rale BBL McF BBL Ratio

50/64 SI '
1120.0 O GSI

28a. Production - IntervalB
Dale First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas ProductionMethod
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BOL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press Cag. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas:Oïl Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rale BBL MCF BBL Ratio

(SeeInstructions and spaces foradditional data on reverse side)
ELECTRONIC SUBMISSION #5122VERIFIED BYTHE BLM WELL INFORMATION SYSTEM

** ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL
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ELECTRONIC SUBMISSION #5122VERIFIED BYTHE BLM WELL INFORMATION SYSTEM

** ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL



28b.Production - Interval C
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr API Gravity

Ciaoke Ag. Press. Csg, 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas:Oil Well Status
Size FIwg. Ptess. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

28c. Production - Interval O
Date Fïrst Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas ProductionMethod
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr.API Gravity

Choke Eg. Press. Csg. 24 HP Oil Gas Water Oss:Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCP BBL Ratio

29. Disposition of Gas(Sold, used forfuel,vented, etc.)
FLARED

30. Summaryof Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation(Log) Markers
Showall importantzones of porosityand contents thereof:Cored intervals and all drill-stem
tests, including depth intervaltested,cushion used, timetool open, flowingand shut-in pressures
and recoveries.

Top
Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name

Meas. Depth
UINTA N 1880 SHALE WASATCH 5398
GREEN RIVER 1880 5350 SANDSTONE/LIMESTONE/SHALE MESAVERDE 8488
WASATCH 5350 8718 SANDSTONE/SHALE MANCOS 12221
MESAVERDE 8718 12200 SANDSTONE/SHALE
MANCOS 12200 /2200 SANDSTONE/SHALE

32. Additionalremarks (includepluggingprocedure):

33. Circleenclosed attachments:
1. Electrical/Mechanical Logs (1 full set req'd.) 2. GeologicReport 3. DST Report 4. Directional Survey
5. SundryNotice for pluggingand cement verification 6. Core Analysis 7 Other:

34. I herebycertify that the foregoing and attachedinformationis complete and correct as determinedfromall availablerecords (see attached instructions):
Electronic Submission #5122Verified by the BLM Well Information System for PHILLIPS PETROLEUM COMPANY.

Sent to the Vernal.

Name(pleaseprint) CATHlBOLES Title APPLICANT

Signature Date 06/22/2001

Title 18 U.S.C.Section 1001and Tide 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any personknowinglyand willfully to make to any departmentor agency
of the UnitedStatesany false,fictitiousor fradulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

** DRAFT ** DRAFT " DRAFT ** DRAFT ** DRAFT ** DRAFT ** DRAFT
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O O

ConocoPhillips
Divisions of Oil, Gas, and Mining

Re: Notice of Address Change, Merger and Name Change Attn: Mr. John Baza
Address Change effective December 2, 2002 1594 West North Temple,
Merger and Name Change effective December 31, 2002 Suite 1210, P. O. Box 145801

Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Gentlemen:

1. Effective December 2, 2002, Phillips Petroleum Company will close its Englewood, Colorado RockyMountain Region office. After that time, all correspondence, notices and invoice for Land related matters shouldbe directed to the address(es) noted below. Note that until December 31, 2002, all properties in which Phillipsheld an interest will continue to be operated by Phillips Petroleum Company, a wholly-owned subsidiary of
ConocoPhillips.

2. On December 31, 2002, Phillips Petroleum Company and Conoco Inc. will merge, and the surviving
corporation will be renamed "ConocoPhillips Company".

In accordance with the notice provisions of the Operating Agreements and other agreements, if any, between ourcompanies, please adjust your company/organization records, effective for address purposes as of December 2,2002, and for company name purposes, as of January 1, 2003, to reflect the following information for addressingand delivery of notices, invoicing and payment, and communications with ConocoPhillips Company. This willalso apply to Lease Sale notices and other lease-related correspondence and notifications.

U.S. Mail Address: Physical Address & Overnight Delivery:

ConocoPhillips Company ConocoPhillips Company
P.O. Box 2l97 550 Westlake Park Blvd.
Houston, Texas 77252 Three Westlake Park
Attn: Chief Landman, 3WL, Room WL 9000
San Juan/Rockies Houston, Texas 77079

Attn: Chief Landman,
San Juan/Rockies

All ballots and official notices/responses sent by facsimile transmission should be sent to the following
contact:

Attn: Chief Landman,
San Juan/Rockies

Fax No.: 832-486-2688 or
832-486-2687

Please contact the undersigned immediately if you have any questions. This notice does not apply to royalty
inquiries, joint interest billings, or revenue remittances. Please continue to use the same addresses you are
curreenrelyyusi h atters

RECE lVED
DECO2 2002
DIVISION OF

UIL GAS AND

O O
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O O
ST OF DELAWARE

FROMRL&F#1 (THU)12.12'02 13:35 ST.13:N 486WWREP 16
DIVISION OF CORPORATIONS
FILED 01: 44 PN 12/12/2002

020763253 - 0064324

CERTIFICATE OF MERGER

of

Conoco Inc.
(a Delaware corporation)

with and into

ConocoPhiRips Company
(a Delaware corporation)

Phillips Petroleum Company,a Delaware corporationto be renamed ConocoPhillips
Company prior to the effective time of this certificate of merger (the"SurvivingCorpontion"),
in compliance with the requirements of the General CorporationLaw of the State of Delaware
(the "DGCL")and desiring to effect a merger of ConocoInc., a Delawarecorporation formerly
incorporated underthe name Du Pont Holdings, Inc. (the "Merging Corporation," andtogether
with the Surviving Corporation, the "Constituent Corporations"), with and into the Surviving
Corporation,and acting by its duly authorized officer, DOESHEREBY CERTIFY that:

First: As of the date heroof, the name and state of incorporation of each of the
Constituent Corporations of the merger are as follows:

NAME STATE OF INCORPORATION

PHILLIPSPETROLEUMCOMPANY Delaware

CONOCO INC. Delaware

Second: An agreement and plan of merger has been approved, adopted, certified,
executed and acknowledged by each of the Constituent Corporations in accordance with the
requirements of Section 251 of the DOCL;

Third: The name of the Surviving Corporation will be ConocoPhillips Company;

Fourth: The Certificateof Incorporationof ConocoPhillipsCompany immediately
prior to the merger shall be the Certificate of Incorporation of the Surviving Corporation until

such time as it may be amended in accordance with applicable law and the provisions themof,

Fifth; T11eexecuted agr¢ement and plan of merger is on file at an oflice of the
survivingCorporation, the address of which is 600 North Dairy Ashford, Houston, Texas
77079;

RECEIVED
novermene 1 JANO8 2003

DIV.OF OIL,GAS&

O O
ST OF DELAWARE

FROMRL&F#1 (THU)12.12'02 13:35 ST.13:N 486WWREP 16
DIVISION OF CORPORATIONS
FILED 01: 44 PN 12/12/2002
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in compliance with the requirements of the General CorporationLaw of the State of Delaware
(the "DGCL")and desiring to effect a merger of ConocoInc., a Delawarecorporation formerly
incorporated underthe name Du Pont Holdings, Inc. (the "Merging Corporation," andtogether
with the Surviving Corporation, the "Constituent Corporations"), with and into the Surviving
Corporation,and acting by its duly authorized officer, DOESHEREBY CERTIFY that:

First: As of the date heroof, the name and state of incorporation of each of the
Constituent Corporations of the merger are as follows:

NAME STATE OF INCORPORATION

PHILLIPSPETROLEUMCOMPANY Delaware

CONOCO INC. Delaware

Second: An agreement and plan of merger has been approved, adopted, certified,
executed and acknowledged by each of the Constituent Corporations in accordance with the
requirements of Section 251 of the DOCL;

Third: The name of the Surviving Corporation will be ConocoPhillips Company;

Fourth: The Certificateof Incorporationof ConocoPhillipsCompany immediately
prior to the merger shall be the Certificate of Incorporation of the Surviving Corporation until

such time as it may be amended in accordance with applicable law and the provisions themof,

Fifth; T11eexecuted agr¢ement and plan of merger is on file at an oflice of the
survivingCorporation, the address of which is 600 North Dairy Ashford, Houston, Texas
77079;

RECEIVED
novermene 1 JANO8 2003
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Sixth: A copy of the agreement and plan of merger will be furnished by the
Surviving Corporation, on request and without cost, to any stockholder of any Constituent
Corporation;and

Seventh: Pursuantto Section103(d) of theDGCL, thiscertificate of mergerwill become
effective at 11:59 p.m.,Easterntime, on December31, 2002.

Dated: December 12,2002

PHILLIPSPETROLEUM COMPANY
(a Delawarecorporatt )

By:
Name: Kick A. Harrington
Title: Senior Vice President, Legal,

and GeneralCounsel

RECElVED
JANO8 2003
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, Phillips has caused this certificate to be executed this
12thday of Decernber. 2002.

PHILLIPS PETROLEUMCOMPANY

By:
Name: 'ck A. Harrington
Title: Senior Vice President, Legal,

and GeneralCounsel

RECEIVED
sooosmo JAN0 8 2003
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'The irst State

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF

DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATTACHED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT

COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF MERGER, WHICH MERGES:

"CONOCO INC.", A DELAWARE CORPORATION,

WITH AND INTO "CONOCOPHILLIPS COMPANY" UNDER THE NAME OF

"CONOCOPHILLIPS COMPANY", A CORPORATION ORGANIZED AND EXISTING
UNDER THE LAWS OF THE STATE OF DELARARE, AS RECEIVED AND FILED
IN THIS OFFICE THE TWELFTE DAY OF DECEMBER, A.D. 2002, AT 1:44
O'CLOCK P.M.

AND I DO HEREBY FURTHER CERTIFY THAT THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF
THE AFORESAID CERTIFICATE OF MERGER IS THE THIRTY-FIRST DAY OF

DECEMBER, A.D. 2002, AT 11:59 O'CLOCK P.M.

RECEIVED
JANO8 219013

DIV,OFOIL,GAS&MINING

Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary of State
0064324 8100M AUTHENTICATION: 2183370

030002793 DATE:
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ENEOOFFUCOAMHMERCE REFERE UMBER(S), CLASSIFICATION(S) & DETAIL(S)

REGISTRATION Corporation - Foreign - Profit
562960-0143

CONOCOPHILLIPS COMPANY

EFFECTIVE EXPIRATION
06/14/1946 *RENEWAL

UNITED STATES CORP CO
CONOCOPHILLIPS COMPANY
GATEWAY TOWER EAST STE 900 RECEIVED10 EAST SOUTH TEMPLE
SLC UT 84133 JANO82003

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE

DIVISION OF CORPORATIONS & COMMERCIAL CODE

REGISTRATION

EFFECTIVE DATE: 06/14/1946

EXPIRATION DATE: *RENEWAL

ISSUED TO: CONOCOPHILLIPS COMPANY

REFERENCE NUMBER(S), CLASSIFICATION(S) & DETAIL(S)
562960-0143 Corporation - Foreign - Profit

*RENEWAL

You will need to renew your registration each anniversary date of the effective date.
Exceptions: DBAs and Business Trusts renew every three (3) years from the effective
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Utah Well Lisi as of 12/24/02

API Well Number Well Name Weli Type Well Status Sec Twpn Twpd Rngn Rngd
43-007-30887-00-00 ANDREEN 32-529 Gas Well APD 32 14 S 10 E
43-007-30865-00-00 COTNER 29-549 Gas Well APD 29 14 S 10 E
43-007-30837-00-00 DALLIN32-615 Gas Well APD 32 13 S 9 E
43-047-34551-00-00 FED 43-24-3 #1 Gas Well APD 24 10 S 17 E
43-047-33982-00-00 FEDERAL 12-17 #1 Gas Well APD 17 10 S 18 E
43-047-34471-00-00 FEDERAL 12-29-7 1 Gas Well APD 29 9 S 19 E
43-047-34472-00-00 FEDERAL 31-31-6 1 Gas Well APD 31 9 S 19 E
43-007-30864-00-00 MCKENDRICK 29-548 Gas Well APD 29 14 S 10 E
43-015-30512-00-00 PPCO 19-379 Gas Well APD 19 16 S 9 E
43-015-30515-00-00 PPCO 24-562 Gas Well APD 24 16 S 8 E
43-015-30548-00-00 PPCO 30-605 Gas Well APD 30 16 S 9 E
43-007-30888-00-00 PRICE 32-438 Gas Well APD 32 14 S 10 E
43-007-30813-00-00 RITZAKIS 33-514 Gas Well APD 33 13 S 9 E
43-007-30766-00-00 RITZAKIS 33-516 Gas Well APD 33 13 S 9 E
43-007-30838-00-00 ROWLEY 32-616 Gas Well APD 32 13 S 9 E
43-007-30863-00-00 SCHMIDT 29-531 Gas Well APD 29 14 S 10 E
43-007-30797-00-00 SEELY 15-498 Gas Well APD 15 14 S 8 E
43-007-30798-00-00 SEELY 15-499 Gas Well APD 15 14 S 8 E
43-007-30799-00-00 SEELY 15-500 Gas Well APD 15 14 S 8 E
43-007-30796-00-00 SEELY 22-492 Gas Well APD 22 14 S 8 E
43-007-30801-00-00 SEELY 22-502 Gas Well APD 22 14 S 8 E
43-007-30802-00-00 SEELY 22-503 Gas Well APD 22 14 S 8 E
43-007-30711-00-00 USA 09-452 Gas Well APD 9 15 S 8 E
43-015-30351-00-00 USA 11-313 Gas Well APD 11 16 S 9 E
43-015-30398-00-00 USA 12-385 Gas Well APD 12 16 S 9 E
43-015-30409-00-00 USA 12-426 Gas Well APD 12 16 S 9 E
43-007-30805-00-00 USA 14-490 Gas Well APD 14 14 S 8 E
43-007-30806-00-00 USA 14-491 Gas Well APD 14 14 S 8 E
43-007-30676-00-00 USA 15-421 Gas Well APD 15 15 S 8 E
43-015-30417-00-00 USA 21-427 Gas Well APD 21 16 S 9 E
43-015-30416-00-00 USA 21-428 Gas Well APD 21 16 S 9 E
43-015-30415-00-00 USA 21-429 Gas Well APD 21 16 S 9 E
43-007-30515-00-00 USA 31-309 Gas Well APD 31 15 S 10 E
43-007-30835-00-00 USA 33-515 Gas Well APD 33 13 S 9 E
43-007-30836-00-00 USA 33-624 Gas Well APD 33 13 S 9 E
43-007-30803-00-00 USA 34-518 Gas Well APD 34 14 S 8 E
43-007-30478-00-00 UTAH 05-224 Gas Well APD 5 15 S 9 E
43-015-30411-00-00 UTAH 16-365 Gas Well APD 16 16 S 9 E
43-015-30412-00-00 UTAH 16-366 Gas Well APD 16 16 S 9 E
43-015-30413-00-00 UTAH 16-430 Gas Well APD 16 16 S 9 E
43-015-30299-00-00 UTAH 18-374 Gas Well APD 18 16 S 9 E
43-015-30420-00-00 UTAH 19-377 Gas Well APD 19 16 S 9 E
43-015-30492-00-00 UTAH 19-378 Gas Well APD 19 16 S 9 E
43-007-30891-00-00 UTAH 19-533 Gas Well APD 19 14 S 10 E
43-015-30414-00-00 UTAH 20-381 Gas Well APD 20 16 S 9 E
43-015-30421-00-00 UTAH 20-382 Gas Well APD 20 16 S 9 E
43-015-30518-00-00 UTAH 25-576 Gas Well APD 25 16 S 8 E
43-015-30539-00-00 UTAH 25-578 Gas Well APD 25 16 S 8 E
43-015-30540-00-00 UTAH 25-579 Gas Well APD 25 16 S 8 E
43-007-30817-00-00 UTAH 25-618 Gas Well APD 25 13 S 9 E
43-015-30543-00-00 UTAH 26-582 Gas Well APD 26 16 S 8 E
43-015-30547-00-00 UTAH 29-608 Gas Well APD 29 16 S 9 E
43-007-30889-00-00 UTAH 32-128 Gas Well APD 32 14 S 10 E
43-007-30814-00-00 UTAH 35-506 Gas Well APD 35 13 S 9
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Utah Well List as of 12/26/02
API Well Number Well Name Well Type Well Status Sec Twpn Twpd Rngn Rngd
43-047-33750-00-00 FEDERAL 34-29 Gas Well P - . 29 9 S 19 E
43-007-30782-00-00 GAROFOLA 26-482 Gas Well P 26 15 S 8 E
43-007-30335-00-00 GIACOLETTO 11-113 Gas Well P 11 14 S 9 E
43-007-30407-00-00 GIACOLETTO 13-120 Gas Well P 13 14 S 9 E
43-007-30345-00-00 GIACOLETTO 14-121 Gas Well P 14 14 S 9|E
43-007-30487-00-00 HELPER &ASSOC 07-307 Gas Well P 7 15 S 9 E
43-007-30459-00-00 HELPER &ASSOC 18-236 Gas Well P 18 15 S 9 E
43-007-30720-00-00 HELPER &ASSOC 18-308 Gas Well P 18 15 S 9 E
43-007-30412-00-00 HELPER &ASSOC 8-232 Gas Well P 8 15 S 9 E
43-007-30258-00-00 HELPER &ASSÕCIATES 7-84 Gas Well P 7 15 S 9 EÄŠ-007-30588-00-00JENSEN 16-132 Gas Well P 16 15 S 10 E
43-007-30420-00-00 KAKATSIDES 31-197 Gas Well P 31 14 S 9 E
43-007-30296-00-00 LDS 17-133 Gas Well P 17 15 S 10 E
43-007-30323-00-00 PAAR 16-146 Gas Well P 16 14 S 9 E
43-047-34286-00-00 PETES WASH 23-12 #1 Gas Well P 12 10 S 17 E
43-007-30748-00-00 PIERUCCI 25-461 Gas Well P 25 15 S 8 E
43-007-30749-00-00 PIERUCCI 25-462 Gas Well P 25 15 S 8 E
43-007-30754-00-00 PIERUCCI 26-463 Gas Well P 26 15 S 8 E
43-007-30755-00-00 PIERUCCI 26-464 Gas Well P 26 15 S 8 E
43-007-30745-00-00 PIERUCCI 26-481 Gas Well P 26 15 S 8 E
43-007-30117-00-00 PINNACLE PEAK 19-171 Gas Well P 19 14 S 9 E
43-007-30845-00-00 PMC 10-526 Gas Well P 10 15 S 8 E
43-007-30282-00-00 POWELL 19-104 Gas Well P 19 15 S 10 E
43-007-30283-00-00 POWELL 19-105 Gas Well P 19 15 S 10 E
43-007-30346-00-00 POWELL 30-173 Gas Well P 30 15 S 10 E
43-015-30279-00-00 PPCO 10-557 Gas Well P 10 16 S 8 E
43-015-30494-00-00 PPCO 15-555 Gas Well P 15 16 S 8 E
43-007-30211-00-00 PRETTYMAN 10-15-34 Gas Well P 10 14 S 9 E
43-007-30340-00-00 PRETTYMAN 11-114 Gas Well P 11 14 S 9 E
43-007-30653-00-00 RGC 21-331 Gas Well P 21 15 S 9 E
43-007-30743-00-00 RGC 21-332 Gas Well P 21 15 S 9 E
43-007-30747-00-00 RGC 25-460 Gas Well P 25 15 S 8 E
43-007-30559-00-00 'RGC 28-318 Gas Well P 28 15 S 9 E
43-007-30518-00-00 RGC 28-319 Gas Well P 28 15 S 9 E
43-007-30509-00-00 RITZAKIS 03-408 Gas Well P 3 14 S 9 E
43-007-30473-00-00 RITZAKIS 5-304 Gas Well P 5 14 S 9 E
43-007-30474-00-00 RITZAKIS 5-305 Gas Well P 5 14 S 9 E
43-007-30475-00-00 RITZAKIS 8-298 Gas Well P 8 14 S 9 E
43-007-30479-00-00 RITZAKIS 8-299 Gas Well P 8 14 S 9 E
43-007-30476-00-00 RITZAKIS 8-300 Gas Well P 8 14 S 9 E
43-007-30374-00-00 ROBERTSON 32-127 Gas Well P 32 14 S 10 E
43-007-30610-00-00 SAMPINOS 16-131 Gas Well P 16 15 S 10 E
43-007-30723-00-00 SAMPINOS 16-454 Gas Well P 16 15 S 10 E
43-007-30765-00-00 SAMPINOS 16-521 Gas Well P 16 15 S 10 E
43-007-30800-00-00 SEELY22-501 Gas Well P 22 14 S 8 E
43-007-30130-00-00 ST OF UT 25-9-1 Gas Well P 25 14 S 9 E
43-007-30142-00-00 ST OF UT 36-3-4 Gas Well P 36 14 S 9 E
43-007-30116-00-00 STELLA-HAMAKER 10-174 Gas Well P 10 15 S 8 E
43-007-30746-00-00 TABOR 23-468 Gas Well P 23 15 S 8 E
43-007-30319-00-00 TELONIS 15-142 Gas Well P 15 14 S 9 E
43-007-30322-00-00 TELONIS 16-145 Gas Well P 16 14 S 9 E

¯

43-007-30300-00-00 TELONIS 19-150 Gas Well P 19 14 S 9 E
43-007-30299-00-00 TELONIS 19-151 Gas Well P 19 14 S 9 E
43-007-30327-00-00 TELONIS 20-152 Gas Well P 20 14 S 9

Utah Well List as of 12/26/02
API Well Number Well Name Well Type Well Status Sec Twpn Twpd Rngn Rngd
43-047-33750-00-00 FEDERAL 34-29 Gas Well P - . 29 9 S 19 E
43-007-30782-00-00 GAROFOLA 26-482 Gas Well P 26 15 S 8 E
43-007-30335-00-00 GIACOLETTO 11-113 Gas Well P 11 14 S 9 E
43-007-30407-00-00 GIACOLETTO 13-120 Gas Well P 13 14 S 9 E
43-007-30345-00-00 GIACOLETTO 14-121 Gas Well P 14 14 S 9|E
43-007-30487-00-00 HELPER &ASSOC 07-307 Gas Well P 7 15 S 9 E
43-007-30459-00-00 HELPER &ASSOC 18-236 Gas Well P 18 15 S 9 E
43-007-30720-00-00 HELPER &ASSOC 18-308 Gas Well P 18 15 S 9 E
43-007-30412-00-00 HELPER &ASSOC 8-232 Gas Well P 8 15 S 9 E
43-007-30258-00-00 HELPER &ASSÕCIATES 7-84 Gas Well P 7 15 S 9 EÄŠ-007-30588-00-00JENSEN 16-132 Gas Well P 16 15 S 10 E
43-007-30420-00-00 KAKATSIDES 31-197 Gas Well P 31 14 S 9 E
43-007-30296-00-00 LDS 17-133 Gas Well P 17 15 S 10 E
43-007-30323-00-00 PAAR 16-146 Gas Well P 16 14 S 9 E
43-047-34286-00-00 PETES WASH 23-12 #1 Gas Well P 12 10 S 17 E
43-007-30748-00-00 PIERUCCI 25-461 Gas Well P 25 15 S 8 E
43-007-30749-00-00 PIERUCCI 25-462 Gas Well P 25 15 S 8 E
43-007-30754-00-00 PIERUCCI 26-463 Gas Well P 26 15 S 8 E
43-007-30755-00-00 PIERUCCI 26-464 Gas Well P 26 15 S 8 E
43-007-30745-00-00 PIERUCCI 26-481 Gas Well P 26 15 S 8 E
43-007-30117-00-00 PINNACLE PEAK 19-171 Gas Well P 19 14 S 9 E
43-007-30845-00-00 PMC 10-526 Gas Well P 10 15 S 8 E
43-007-30282-00-00 POWELL 19-104 Gas Well P 19 15 S 10 E
43-007-30283-00-00 POWELL 19-105 Gas Well P 19 15 S 10 E
43-007-30346-00-00 POWELL 30-173 Gas Well P 30 15 S 10 E
43-015-30279-00-00 PPCO 10-557 Gas Well P 10 16 S 8 E
43-015-30494-00-00 PPCO 15-555 Gas Well P 15 16 S 8 E
43-007-30211-00-00 PRETTYMAN 10-15-34 Gas Well P 10 14 S 9 E
43-007-30340-00-00 PRETTYMAN 11-114 Gas Well P 11 14 S 9 E
43-007-30653-00-00 RGC 21-331 Gas Well P 21 15 S 9 E
43-007-30743-00-00 RGC 21-332 Gas Well P 21 15 S 9 E
43-007-30747-00-00 RGC 25-460 Gas Well P 25 15 S 8 E
43-007-30559-00-00 'RGC 28-318 Gas Well P 28 15 S 9 E
43-007-30518-00-00 RGC 28-319 Gas Well P 28 15 S 9 E
43-007-30509-00-00 RITZAKIS 03-408 Gas Well P 3 14 S 9 E
43-007-30473-00-00 RITZAKIS 5-304 Gas Well P 5 14 S 9 E
43-007-30474-00-00 RITZAKIS 5-305 Gas Well P 5 14 S 9 E
43-007-30475-00-00 RITZAKIS 8-298 Gas Well P 8 14 S 9 E
43-007-30479-00-00 RITZAKIS 8-299 Gas Well P 8 14 S 9 E
43-007-30476-00-00 RITZAKIS 8-300 Gas Well P 8 14 S 9 E
43-007-30374-00-00 ROBERTSON 32-127 Gas Well P 32 14 S 10 E
43-007-30610-00-00 SAMPINOS 16-131 Gas Well P 16 15 S 10 E
43-007-30723-00-00 SAMPINOS 16-454 Gas Well P 16 15 S 10 E
43-007-30765-00-00 SAMPINOS 16-521 Gas Well P 16 15 S 10 E
43-007-30800-00-00 SEELY22-501 Gas Well P 22 14 S 8 E
43-007-30130-00-00 ST OF UT 25-9-1 Gas Well P 25 14 S 9 E
43-007-30142-00-00 ST OF UT 36-3-4 Gas Well P 36 14 S 9 E
43-007-30116-00-00 STELLA-HAMAKER 10-174 Gas Well P 10 15 S 8 E
43-007-30746-00-00 TABOR 23-468 Gas Well P 23 15 S 8 E
43-007-30319-00-00 TELONIS 15-142 Gas Well P 15 14 S 9 E
43-007-30322-00-00 TELONIS 16-145 Gas Well P 16 14 S 9 E

¯

43-007-30300-00-00 TELONIS 19-150 Gas Well P 19 14 S 9 E
43-007-30299-00-00 TELONIS 19-151 Gas Well P 19 14 S 9 E
43-007-30327-00-00 TELONIS 20-152 Gas Well P 20 14 S 9

Utah Well List as of 12/26/02
API Well Number Well Name Well Type Well Status Sec Twpn Twpd Rngn Rngd
43-047-33750-00-00 FEDERAL 34-29 Gas Well P - . 29 9 S 19 E
43-007-30782-00-00 GAROFOLA 26-482 Gas Well P 26 15 S 8 E
43-007-30335-00-00 GIACOLETTO 11-113 Gas Well P 11 14 S 9 E
43-007-30407-00-00 GIACOLETTO 13-120 Gas Well P 13 14 S 9 E
43-007-30345-00-00 GIACOLETTO 14-121 Gas Well P 14 14 S 9|E
43-007-30487-00-00 HELPER &ASSOC 07-307 Gas Well P 7 15 S 9 E
43-007-30459-00-00 HELPER &ASSOC 18-236 Gas Well P 18 15 S 9 E
43-007-30720-00-00 HELPER &ASSOC 18-308 Gas Well P 18 15 S 9 E
43-007-30412-00-00 HELPER &ASSOC 8-232 Gas Well P 8 15 S 9 E
43-007-30258-00-00 HELPER &ASSÕCIATES 7-84 Gas Well P 7 15 S 9 EÄŠ-007-30588-00-00JENSEN 16-132 Gas Well P 16 15 S 10 E
43-007-30420-00-00 KAKATSIDES 31-197 Gas Well P 31 14 S 9 E
43-007-30296-00-00 LDS 17-133 Gas Well P 17 15 S 10 E
43-007-30323-00-00 PAAR 16-146 Gas Well P 16 14 S 9 E
43-047-34286-00-00 PETES WASH 23-12 #1 Gas Well P 12 10 S 17 E
43-007-30748-00-00 PIERUCCI 25-461 Gas Well P 25 15 S 8 E
43-007-30749-00-00 PIERUCCI 25-462 Gas Well P 25 15 S 8 E
43-007-30754-00-00 PIERUCCI 26-463 Gas Well P 26 15 S 8 E
43-007-30755-00-00 PIERUCCI 26-464 Gas Well P 26 15 S 8 E
43-007-30745-00-00 PIERUCCI 26-481 Gas Well P 26 15 S 8 E
43-007-30117-00-00 PINNACLE PEAK 19-171 Gas Well P 19 14 S 9 E
43-007-30845-00-00 PMC 10-526 Gas Well P 10 15 S 8 E
43-007-30282-00-00 POWELL 19-104 Gas Well P 19 15 S 10 E
43-007-30283-00-00 POWELL 19-105 Gas Well P 19 15 S 10 E
43-007-30346-00-00 POWELL 30-173 Gas Well P 30 15 S 10 E
43-015-30279-00-00 PPCO 10-557 Gas Well P 10 16 S 8 E
43-015-30494-00-00 PPCO 15-555 Gas Well P 15 16 S 8 E
43-007-30211-00-00 PRETTYMAN 10-15-34 Gas Well P 10 14 S 9 E
43-007-30340-00-00 PRETTYMAN 11-114 Gas Well P 11 14 S 9 E
43-007-30653-00-00 RGC 21-331 Gas Well P 21 15 S 9 E
43-007-30743-00-00 RGC 21-332 Gas Well P 21 15 S 9 E
43-007-30747-00-00 RGC 25-460 Gas Well P 25 15 S 8 E
43-007-30559-00-00 'RGC 28-318 Gas Well P 28 15 S 9 E
43-007-30518-00-00 RGC 28-319 Gas Well P 28 15 S 9 E
43-007-30509-00-00 RITZAKIS 03-408 Gas Well P 3 14 S 9 E
43-007-30473-00-00 RITZAKIS 5-304 Gas Well P 5 14 S 9 E
43-007-30474-00-00 RITZAKIS 5-305 Gas Well P 5 14 S 9 E
43-007-30475-00-00 RITZAKIS 8-298 Gas Well P 8 14 S 9 E
43-007-30479-00-00 RITZAKIS 8-299 Gas Well P 8 14 S 9 E
43-007-30476-00-00 RITZAKIS 8-300 Gas Well P 8 14 S 9 E
43-007-30374-00-00 ROBERTSON 32-127 Gas Well P 32 14 S 10 E
43-007-30610-00-00 SAMPINOS 16-131 Gas Well P 16 15 S 10 E
43-007-30723-00-00 SAMPINOS 16-454 Gas Well P 16 15 S 10 E
43-007-30765-00-00 SAMPINOS 16-521 Gas Well P 16 15 S 10 E
43-007-30800-00-00 SEELY22-501 Gas Well P 22 14 S 8 E
43-007-30130-00-00 ST OF UT 25-9-1 Gas Well P 25 14 S 9 E
43-007-30142-00-00 ST OF UT 36-3-4 Gas Well P 36 14 S 9 E
43-007-30116-00-00 STELLA-HAMAKER 10-174 Gas Well P 10 15 S 8 E
43-007-30746-00-00 TABOR 23-468 Gas Well P 23 15 S 8 E
43-007-30319-00-00 TELONIS 15-142 Gas Well P 15 14 S 9 E
43-007-30322-00-00 TELONIS 16-145 Gas Well P 16 14 S 9 E

¯

43-007-30300-00-00 TELONIS 19-150 Gas Well P 19 14 S 9 E
43-007-30299-00-00 TELONIS 19-151 Gas Well P 19 14 S 9 E
43-007-30327-00-00 TELONIS 20-152 Gas Well P 20 14 S 9



O O
Utah Well Lis: as of 12/23/02

API Well Number Well Name Well Type Well Status Sec Twpn Twpd Rngn Rngd
43-007-30631-00-00 USA 13-419 Gas Well P 13 15 S 8 E
43-007-30707-00-00 USA 13-447 Gas Well P 13 14 S 8 E
43-007-30706-00-00 USA 13-470 Gas Well P 13 14 S 8 E
43-007-30789-00-00 USA 13-474 Gas Well P 13 14 S 8 E
43-007-30790-00-00 USA 13-475 Gas Well P 13 14 S 8 E
43-007-30568-00-00 USA 13-91 Gas Well P 13 14 S 9 E
43-007-30404-00-00 USA 14-122 Gas Well P 14 14 S 9 E
43-015-30418-00-00 USA 1-425 Gas Well P 1 16 S 9 E
43-007-30579-00-00 USA 14-325 Gas Well P 14 15 S 8 E
43-007-30634-00-00 USA 14-386 Gas Well P 14 15 S 8 E
43-007-30646-00-00 USA 14-416 Gas Well P 14 15 S 8 E
43-007-30647-00-00 USA 14-417 Gas Well P 14 15 S 8 E
43-007-30791-00-00 USA 14-476 Gas Well P 14 14 S 8 E
43-007-30792-00-00 USA 14-477 Gas Well P 14 14 S 8 E
43-007-30529-00-00 USA 14-74 Gas Well P _ 14 14 S 9 E
43-007-30263-00-00 USA 14-75 Gas Well P 14 14 S 9 E
43-007-30450-00-00 USA 15-176 Gas Well P 15 14 S 9 E
43-007-30423-00-00 USA 15-177 Gas Well P 15 14 S 9 E
43-007-30690-00-00 USA 15-420 Gas Well P 15 15 S 8 E
43-007-30691-00-00 USA 15-422 Gas Well P 15 15 S 8 E
43-007-30264-00-00 USA 15-88 Gas Well P 15 14 S 9 E
43-007-30422-00-00 USA 17-179 Gas Well P 17 14 S 9 E
43-007-30622-00-00 USA 17-180A Gas Well P 17 14 S 9 E
43-007-30618-00-00 USA 18-181 Gas Well P 18 14 S 9 E
43-007-30417-00-00 USA 18-182 Gas Well P 18 14 S 9 E
43-007-30619-00-00 USA 18-435 Gas Well P 18 14 S 9 E
43-007-30393-00-00 USA 19-222 Gas Well P 19 15 S 10 E
43-007-30392-00-00 USA 19-73 Gas Well P 19 15 S 10 E
43-007-30448-00-00 USA 20-287 Gas Well P 20 15 S 10 E
43-007-30451-00-00 USA 20-288 Gas Well P 20 15 S 10 E
43-007-30590-00-00 USA 20-398 Gas Well P 20 15 S 10 E
43-007-30591-00-00 USA 20-399 Gas Well P 20 15 S 10 E
43-007-30424-00-00 USA 21-184 Gas Well P 21 14 S 9 E
43-007-30425-00-00 USA 21-35 Gas Well P 21 14 S 9 E
43-007-30426-00-00 USA 22-185 Gas Well P 22 14 S 9 E
43-007-30477-00-00 USA 22-186 Gas Well P 22 14 S 9 E
43-007-30700-00-00 USA 22-466 Gas Well P 22 15 S 8 E
43-007-30611-00-00 USA 23-423 Gas Well P 23 14 S 8 E
43-007-30650-00-00 USA 23-445 Gas Well P 23 15 S 8 E
43-007-30704-00-00 USA 23-451 Gas Well P 23 15 S 8 E
43-007-30503-00-00 USA 23-467 Gas Well P 23 15 S 8 E
43-007-30793-00-00 USA 23-478 Gas Well P 23 14 S 8 E
43-007-30794-00-00 USA 23-479 Gas Well P 23 14 S 8 E
43-007-30795-00-00 USA 23-480 Gas Well P 23 14 S 8 E
43-007-30469-00-00 USA 24-183 Gas Well P 24 14 S 8 E
43-007-30612-00-00 USA 24-387 Gas Well P 24 14 S 8 E
43-007-30613-00-00 USA 24-388 Gas Well P 24 14 S 8 E
43-007-30651-00-00 USA 24-443 Gas Well P 24 15 S i E
43-007-30648-00-00 USA 24-444 Gas Well P 24 15 S 8 E
43-007-30708-00-00 USA 24-446 Gas Well P 24 14 S 8 E
43-007-30652-00-00 USA 24-448 Gas Well P 24 15 S 8 E
43-007-30705-00-00 USA 24-449 Gas Well P 24 15 S 8 E
43-007-30505-00-00 USA 25-459 Gas Well P 25 15 S 8 E
43-007-30614-00-00 USA26-393 Gas Well P 26 14 S

O O
Utah Well Lis: as of 12/23/02

API Well Number Well Name Well Type Well Status Sec Twpn Twpd Rngn Rngd
43-007-30631-00-00 USA 13-419 Gas Well P 13 15 S 8 E
43-007-30707-00-00 USA 13-447 Gas Well P 13 14 S 8 E
43-007-30706-00-00 USA 13-470 Gas Well P 13 14 S 8 E
43-007-30789-00-00 USA 13-474 Gas Well P 13 14 S 8 E
43-007-30790-00-00 USA 13-475 Gas Well P 13 14 S 8 E
43-007-30568-00-00 USA 13-91 Gas Well P 13 14 S 9 E
43-007-30404-00-00 USA 14-122 Gas Well P 14 14 S 9 E
43-015-30418-00-00 USA 1-425 Gas Well P 1 16 S 9 E
43-007-30579-00-00 USA 14-325 Gas Well P 14 15 S 8 E
43-007-30634-00-00 USA 14-386 Gas Well P 14 15 S 8 E
43-007-30646-00-00 USA 14-416 Gas Well P 14 15 S 8 E
43-007-30647-00-00 USA 14-417 Gas Well P 14 15 S 8 E
43-007-30791-00-00 USA 14-476 Gas Well P 14 14 S 8 E
43-007-30792-00-00 USA 14-477 Gas Well P 14 14 S 8 E
43-007-30529-00-00 USA 14-74 Gas Well P _ 14 14 S 9 E
43-007-30263-00-00 USA 14-75 Gas Well P 14 14 S 9 E
43-007-30450-00-00 USA 15-176 Gas Well P 15 14 S 9 E
43-007-30423-00-00 USA 15-177 Gas Well P 15 14 S 9 E
43-007-30690-00-00 USA 15-420 Gas Well P 15 15 S 8 E
43-007-30691-00-00 USA 15-422 Gas Well P 15 15 S 8 E
43-007-30264-00-00 USA 15-88 Gas Well P 15 14 S 9 E
43-007-30422-00-00 USA 17-179 Gas Well P 17 14 S 9 E
43-007-30622-00-00 USA 17-180A Gas Well P 17 14 S 9 E
43-007-30618-00-00 USA 18-181 Gas Well P 18 14 S 9 E
43-007-30417-00-00 USA 18-182 Gas Well P 18 14 S 9 E
43-007-30619-00-00 USA 18-435 Gas Well P 18 14 S 9 E
43-007-30393-00-00 USA 19-222 Gas Well P 19 15 S 10 E
43-007-30392-00-00 USA 19-73 Gas Well P 19 15 S 10 E
43-007-30448-00-00 USA 20-287 Gas Well P 20 15 S 10 E
43-007-30451-00-00 USA 20-288 Gas Well P 20 15 S 10 E
43-007-30590-00-00 USA 20-398 Gas Well P 20 15 S 10 E
43-007-30591-00-00 USA 20-399 Gas Well P 20 15 S 10 E
43-007-30424-00-00 USA 21-184 Gas Well P 21 14 S 9 E
43-007-30425-00-00 USA 21-35 Gas Well P 21 14 S 9 E
43-007-30426-00-00 USA 22-185 Gas Well P 22 14 S 9 E
43-007-30477-00-00 USA 22-186 Gas Well P 22 14 S 9 E
43-007-30700-00-00 USA 22-466 Gas Well P 22 15 S 8 E
43-007-30611-00-00 USA 23-423 Gas Well P 23 14 S 8 E
43-007-30650-00-00 USA 23-445 Gas Well P 23 15 S 8 E
43-007-30704-00-00 USA 23-451 Gas Well P 23 15 S 8 E
43-007-30503-00-00 USA 23-467 Gas Well P 23 15 S 8 E
43-007-30793-00-00 USA 23-478 Gas Well P 23 14 S 8 E
43-007-30794-00-00 USA 23-479 Gas Well P 23 14 S 8 E
43-007-30795-00-00 USA 23-480 Gas Well P 23 14 S 8 E
43-007-30469-00-00 USA 24-183 Gas Well P 24 14 S 8 E
43-007-30612-00-00 USA 24-387 Gas Well P 24 14 S 8 E
43-007-30613-00-00 USA 24-388 Gas Well P 24 14 S 8 E
43-007-30651-00-00 USA 24-443 Gas Well P 24 15 S i E
43-007-30648-00-00 USA 24-444 Gas Well P 24 15 S 8 E
43-007-30708-00-00 USA 24-446 Gas Well P 24 14 S 8 E
43-007-30652-00-00 USA 24-448 Gas Well P 24 15 S 8 E
43-007-30705-00-00 USA 24-449 Gas Well P 24 15 S 8 E
43-007-30505-00-00 USA 25-459 Gas Well P 25 15 S 8 E
43-007-30614-00-00 USA26-393 Gas Well P 26 14 S

O O
Utah Well Lis: as of 12/23/02

API Well Number Well Name Well Type Well Status Sec Twpn Twpd Rngn Rngd
43-007-30631-00-00 USA 13-419 Gas Well P 13 15 S 8 E
43-007-30707-00-00 USA 13-447 Gas Well P 13 14 S 8 E
43-007-30706-00-00 USA 13-470 Gas Well P 13 14 S 8 E
43-007-30789-00-00 USA 13-474 Gas Well P 13 14 S 8 E
43-007-30790-00-00 USA 13-475 Gas Well P 13 14 S 8 E
43-007-30568-00-00 USA 13-91 Gas Well P 13 14 S 9 E
43-007-30404-00-00 USA 14-122 Gas Well P 14 14 S 9 E
43-015-30418-00-00 USA 1-425 Gas Well P 1 16 S 9 E
43-007-30579-00-00 USA 14-325 Gas Well P 14 15 S 8 E
43-007-30634-00-00 USA 14-386 Gas Well P 14 15 S 8 E
43-007-30646-00-00 USA 14-416 Gas Well P 14 15 S 8 E
43-007-30647-00-00 USA 14-417 Gas Well P 14 15 S 8 E
43-007-30791-00-00 USA 14-476 Gas Well P 14 14 S 8 E
43-007-30792-00-00 USA 14-477 Gas Well P 14 14 S 8 E
43-007-30529-00-00 USA 14-74 Gas Well P _ 14 14 S 9 E
43-007-30263-00-00 USA 14-75 Gas Well P 14 14 S 9 E
43-007-30450-00-00 USA 15-176 Gas Well P 15 14 S 9 E
43-007-30423-00-00 USA 15-177 Gas Well P 15 14 S 9 E
43-007-30690-00-00 USA 15-420 Gas Well P 15 15 S 8 E
43-007-30691-00-00 USA 15-422 Gas Well P 15 15 S 8 E
43-007-30264-00-00 USA 15-88 Gas Well P 15 14 S 9 E
43-007-30422-00-00 USA 17-179 Gas Well P 17 14 S 9 E
43-007-30622-00-00 USA 17-180A Gas Well P 17 14 S 9 E
43-007-30618-00-00 USA 18-181 Gas Well P 18 14 S 9 E
43-007-30417-00-00 USA 18-182 Gas Well P 18 14 S 9 E
43-007-30619-00-00 USA 18-435 Gas Well P 18 14 S 9 E
43-007-30393-00-00 USA 19-222 Gas Well P 19 15 S 10 E
43-007-30392-00-00 USA 19-73 Gas Well P 19 15 S 10 E
43-007-30448-00-00 USA 20-287 Gas Well P 20 15 S 10 E
43-007-30451-00-00 USA 20-288 Gas Well P 20 15 S 10 E
43-007-30590-00-00 USA 20-398 Gas Well P 20 15 S 10 E
43-007-30591-00-00 USA 20-399 Gas Well P 20 15 S 10 E
43-007-30424-00-00 USA 21-184 Gas Well P 21 14 S 9 E
43-007-30425-00-00 USA 21-35 Gas Well P 21 14 S 9 E
43-007-30426-00-00 USA 22-185 Gas Well P 22 14 S 9 E
43-007-30477-00-00 USA 22-186 Gas Well P 22 14 S 9 E
43-007-30700-00-00 USA 22-466 Gas Well P 22 15 S 8 E
43-007-30611-00-00 USA 23-423 Gas Well P 23 14 S 8 E
43-007-30650-00-00 USA 23-445 Gas Well P 23 15 S 8 E
43-007-30704-00-00 USA 23-451 Gas Well P 23 15 S 8 E
43-007-30503-00-00 USA 23-467 Gas Well P 23 15 S 8 E
43-007-30793-00-00 USA 23-478 Gas Well P 23 14 S 8 E
43-007-30794-00-00 USA 23-479 Gas Well P 23 14 S 8 E
43-007-30795-00-00 USA 23-480 Gas Well P 23 14 S 8 E
43-007-30469-00-00 USA 24-183 Gas Well P 24 14 S 8 E
43-007-30612-00-00 USA 24-387 Gas Well P 24 14 S 8 E
43-007-30613-00-00 USA 24-388 Gas Well P 24 14 S 8 E
43-007-30651-00-00 USA 24-443 Gas Well P 24 15 S i E
43-007-30648-00-00 USA 24-444 Gas Well P 24 15 S 8 E
43-007-30708-00-00 USA 24-446 Gas Well P 24 14 S 8 E
43-007-30652-00-00 USA 24-448 Gas Well P 24 15 S 8 E
43-007-30705-00-00 USA 24-449 Gas Well P 24 15 S 8 E
43-007-30505-00-00 USA 25-459 Gas Well P 25 15 S 8 E
43-007-30614-00-00 USA26-393 Gas Well P 26 14 S
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43-007-30430-00-00 UTAH 06-223 Gas Well P 6 15 S 9 E
43-007-30562-00-00 UTAH 06-330 Gas Well P 6 15 S 9 E
43-007-30716-00-00 UTAH 06-483 Gas Well P 6 15 S 9 E
43-007-30409-00-00 ÜTAH 07-234 Gas Well P 7 15 S 9 E
43-007-30421-00-00 UTAH 07-235 Gas Well P 7 15 S 9 E
43-007-30411-00-00 UTAH 08-231 Gas Well P 8 15 S 9 E
43-007-30488-00-00 UTAH 08-233 Gas Well P 8 15 S 9 E
43-015-30464-00-00 UTAH 08-354 Gas Well P 8 16 S 9 E
43-015-30378-00-00 UTAH 08-355 Gas Well P 8 16 S 9 E
43-015-30379-00-00 UTAH 08-356 Gas Well P 8 16 S 9 E
43-015-30380-00-00 UTAH 08-357 Gas Well P 8 16 S 9 E
43-007-30449-00-00 UTAH 09-227 Gas Well P 9 15 S 9 E
43-007-30561-00-00 UTAH 09-329 Gas Well P 9 15 S 9 E
43-015-30300-00-00 UTAH 09-358 Gas Well P 9 16 S 9 E
43-015-30407-00-00 UTAH 09-359 Gas Well P 9 16 S 9 E
43-015-30397-00-00 UTAH 09-360 Gas Well P 9 16 S 9 E
43-015-30408-00-00 UTAH 09-361 Gas Well P 9 16 S 9 E
43-007-30580-00-00 UTAH 09-412 Gas Well P 9 15 S 10 E
43-007-30605-00-00 UTAH 09-413 Gas Well P 9 15 S 10 E
43-007-30657-00-00 UTAH 09-450 Gas Well P 9 15 S 10 E
43-007-30722-00-00 UTAH 09-453 Gas Well P 9 15 S 10 E
43-007-30302-00-00 UTAH 10-01-36 Gas Well P 10 15 S 9 E
43-007-30298-00-00 UTAH 10-219 Gas Well P 10 15 S 9 E
43-007-30432-00-00 UTAH 10-220 Gas Well P 10 15 S 9 E
43-007-30303-00-00 UTAH 10-221 (Gas Well P 10 15 S 9 E
43-007-30228-00-00 UTAH 11-50 Gas Well P 11 15 S 9 E
43-007-30229-00-00 UTAH 11-51 Gas Well P 11 15 S 9 E
43-007-30230-00-00 UTAH 11-52 Gas Well P 11 15 S 9 E
43-007-30231-00-00 UTAH 11-53 Gas Well P 11 15 S

¯9

E
43-007-30467-00-00 UTAH 1-209 Gas Well P 1 15 S 8 E
43-007-30210-00-00 UTAH 12-15-37 Gas Well P 12 15 S 9 E
43-007-30232-00-00 UTAH 12-54 Gas Well P 12 15 S 9 E
43-007-30233-00-00 UTAH 12-55 Gas Well P 12 15 S 9 E
43-007-30234-00-00 UTAH 12-56 Gas Well P 12 15 S 9 E
43-015-30493-00-00 UTAH 13-376 Gas Well P 13 16 S 8 E
43-015-30301-00-00 UTAH 13-550 Gas Well P 13 16 S 8 E
43-007-30243-00-00 UTAH 13-65 Gas Well P 13 15 S 9 E
43-007-30244-00-00 UTAH 13-66 _ |Gas Well P 13 15 S 9 E
43-007-30245-00-00 UTAH 13-67 Gas Well P 13 15 S 9 E
43-007-30246-00-00 UTAH 13-68 Gas Well P 13 15 S 9 E
43-007-30439-00-00 UTAH 13-92 Gas Well P 13 14 S 9 E
43-007-30220-00-00 UTAH 1-È Gas Well P 1 15 S 9 E
43-007-30221-00-00 UTAH 1-43 Gas Well P 1 15 S 9 E
43-007-30222-00-00 UTAH 1-44 Gas Well P 1 15 S 9 E
43-007-30223-00-00 UTAH 1-45 Gas Well P 1 15 S 9 E
43-015-30330-00-00 UTAH 14-551 Gas Well P 14 16 S 8 E
43-015-30331-00-00 UTAH 14-552 Gas Well P 14 16 S 8 E
43-007-30239-00-00 UTAH 14-61 Gas Well P 14 15 S 9 E
43-007-30240-00-00 UTAH 14-62 Gas Well P 14 15 S 9 E
43-007-30241-00-00 UTAH 14-63 Gas Well P 14 15 S 9 E
43-007-30242-00-00 UTAH14-64 Gas Well P 14 15 S 9 E
43-015-30334-00-00 UTAH 15-553 Gas Well P 15 16 S 8 E
43-007-30416-00-00 UTAH 17-101 Gas Well P 17 15 S 10 E
43-007-30277-00-00 UTAH 17-102 Gas Well P 17 15 S 10
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43-007-30430-00-00 UTAH 06-223 Gas Well P 6 15 S 9 E
43-007-30562-00-00 UTAH 06-330 Gas Well P 6 15 S 9 E
43-007-30716-00-00 UTAH 06-483 Gas Well P 6 15 S 9 E
43-007-30409-00-00 ÜTAH 07-234 Gas Well P 7 15 S 9 E
43-007-30421-00-00 UTAH 07-235 Gas Well P 7 15 S 9 E
43-007-30411-00-00 UTAH 08-231 Gas Well P 8 15 S 9 E
43-007-30488-00-00 UTAH 08-233 Gas Well P 8 15 S 9 E
43-015-30464-00-00 UTAH 08-354 Gas Well P 8 16 S 9 E
43-015-30378-00-00 UTAH 08-355 Gas Well P 8 16 S 9 E
43-015-30379-00-00 UTAH 08-356 Gas Well P 8 16 S 9 E
43-015-30380-00-00 UTAH 08-357 Gas Well P 8 16 S 9 E
43-007-30449-00-00 UTAH 09-227 Gas Well P 9 15 S 9 E
43-007-30561-00-00 UTAH 09-329 Gas Well P 9 15 S 9 E
43-015-30300-00-00 UTAH 09-358 Gas Well P 9 16 S 9 E
43-015-30407-00-00 UTAH 09-359 Gas Well P 9 16 S 9 E
43-015-30397-00-00 UTAH 09-360 Gas Well P 9 16 S 9 E
43-015-30408-00-00 UTAH 09-361 Gas Well P 9 16 S 9 E
43-007-30580-00-00 UTAH 09-412 Gas Well P 9 15 S 10 E
43-007-30605-00-00 UTAH 09-413 Gas Well P 9 15 S 10 E
43-007-30657-00-00 UTAH 09-450 Gas Well P 9 15 S 10 E
43-007-30722-00-00 UTAH 09-453 Gas Well P 9 15 S 10 E
43-007-30302-00-00 UTAH 10-01-36 Gas Well P 10 15 S 9 E
43-007-30298-00-00 UTAH 10-219 Gas Well P 10 15 S 9 E
43-007-30432-00-00 UTAH 10-220 Gas Well P 10 15 S 9 E
43-007-30303-00-00 UTAH 10-221 (Gas Well P 10 15 S 9 E
43-007-30228-00-00 UTAH 11-50 Gas Well P 11 15 S 9 E
43-007-30229-00-00 UTAH 11-51 Gas Well P 11 15 S 9 E
43-007-30230-00-00 UTAH 11-52 Gas Well P 11 15 S 9 E
43-007-30231-00-00 UTAH 11-53 Gas Well P 11 15 S
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E
43-007-30467-00-00 UTAH 1-209 Gas Well P 1 15 S 8 E
43-007-30210-00-00 UTAH 12-15-37 Gas Well P 12 15 S 9 E
43-007-30232-00-00 UTAH 12-54 Gas Well P 12 15 S 9 E
43-007-30233-00-00 UTAH 12-55 Gas Well P 12 15 S 9 E
43-007-30234-00-00 UTAH 12-56 Gas Well P 12 15 S 9 E
43-015-30493-00-00 UTAH 13-376 Gas Well P 13 16 S 8 E
43-015-30301-00-00 UTAH 13-550 Gas Well P 13 16 S 8 E
43-007-30243-00-00 UTAH 13-65 Gas Well P 13 15 S 9 E
43-007-30244-00-00 UTAH 13-66 _ |Gas Well P 13 15 S 9 E
43-007-30245-00-00 UTAH 13-67 Gas Well P 13 15 S 9 E
43-007-30246-00-00 UTAH 13-68 Gas Well P 13 15 S 9 E
43-007-30439-00-00 UTAH 13-92 Gas Well P 13 14 S 9 E
43-007-30220-00-00 UTAH 1-È Gas Well P 1 15 S 9 E
43-007-30221-00-00 UTAH 1-43 Gas Well P 1 15 S 9 E
43-007-30222-00-00 UTAH 1-44 Gas Well P 1 15 S 9 E
43-007-30223-00-00 UTAH 1-45 Gas Well P 1 15 S 9 E
43-015-30330-00-00 UTAH 14-551 Gas Well P 14 16 S 8 E
43-015-30331-00-00 UTAH 14-552 Gas Well P 14 16 S 8 E
43-007-30239-00-00 UTAH 14-61 Gas Well P 14 15 S 9 E
43-007-30240-00-00 UTAH 14-62 Gas Well P 14 15 S 9 E
43-007-30241-00-00 UTAH 14-63 Gas Well P 14 15 S 9 E
43-007-30242-00-00 UTAH14-64 Gas Well P 14 15 S 9 E
43-015-30334-00-00 UTAH 15-553 Gas Well P 15 16 S 8 E
43-007-30416-00-00 UTAH 17-101 Gas Well P 17 15 S 10 E
43-007-30277-00-00 UTAH 17-102 Gas Well P 17 15 S 10
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43-007-30430-00-00 UTAH 06-223 Gas Well P 6 15 S 9 E
43-007-30562-00-00 UTAH 06-330 Gas Well P 6 15 S 9 E
43-007-30716-00-00 UTAH 06-483 Gas Well P 6 15 S 9 E
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43-007-30421-00-00 UTAH 07-235 Gas Well P 7 15 S 9 E
43-007-30411-00-00 UTAH 08-231 Gas Well P 8 15 S 9 E
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43-015-30378-00-00 UTAH 08-355 Gas Well P 8 16 S 9 E
43-015-30379-00-00 UTAH 08-356 Gas Well P 8 16 S 9 E
43-015-30380-00-00 UTAH 08-357 Gas Well P 8 16 S 9 E
43-007-30449-00-00 UTAH 09-227 Gas Well P 9 15 S 9 E
43-007-30561-00-00 UTAH 09-329 Gas Well P 9 15 S 9 E
43-015-30300-00-00 UTAH 09-358 Gas Well P 9 16 S 9 E
43-015-30407-00-00 UTAH 09-359 Gas Well P 9 16 S 9 E
43-015-30397-00-00 UTAH 09-360 Gas Well P 9 16 S 9 E
43-015-30408-00-00 UTAH 09-361 Gas Well P 9 16 S 9 E
43-007-30580-00-00 UTAH 09-412 Gas Well P 9 15 S 10 E
43-007-30605-00-00 UTAH 09-413 Gas Well P 9 15 S 10 E
43-007-30657-00-00 UTAH 09-450 Gas Well P 9 15 S 10 E
43-007-30722-00-00 UTAH 09-453 Gas Well P 9 15 S 10 E
43-007-30302-00-00 UTAH 10-01-36 Gas Well P 10 15 S 9 E
43-007-30298-00-00 UTAH 10-219 Gas Well P 10 15 S 9 E
43-007-30432-00-00 UTAH 10-220 Gas Well P 10 15 S 9 E
43-007-30303-00-00 UTAH 10-221 (Gas Well P 10 15 S 9 E
43-007-30228-00-00 UTAH 11-50 Gas Well P 11 15 S 9 E
43-007-30229-00-00 UTAH 11-51 Gas Well P 11 15 S 9 E
43-007-30230-00-00 UTAH 11-52 Gas Well P 11 15 S 9 E
43-007-30231-00-00 UTAH 11-53 Gas Well P 11 15 S
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E
43-007-30467-00-00 UTAH 1-209 Gas Well P 1 15 S 8 E
43-007-30210-00-00 UTAH 12-15-37 Gas Well P 12 15 S 9 E
43-007-30232-00-00 UTAH 12-54 Gas Well P 12 15 S 9 E
43-007-30233-00-00 UTAH 12-55 Gas Well P 12 15 S 9 E
43-007-30234-00-00 UTAH 12-56 Gas Well P 12 15 S 9 E
43-015-30493-00-00 UTAH 13-376 Gas Well P 13 16 S 8 E
43-015-30301-00-00 UTAH 13-550 Gas Well P 13 16 S 8 E
43-007-30243-00-00 UTAH 13-65 Gas Well P 13 15 S 9 E
43-007-30244-00-00 UTAH 13-66 _ |Gas Well P 13 15 S 9 E
43-007-30245-00-00 UTAH 13-67 Gas Well P 13 15 S 9 E
43-007-30246-00-00 UTAH 13-68 Gas Well P 13 15 S 9 E
43-007-30439-00-00 UTAH 13-92 Gas Well P 13 14 S 9 E
43-007-30220-00-00 UTAH 1-È Gas Well P 1 15 S 9 E
43-007-30221-00-00 UTAH 1-43 Gas Well P 1 15 S 9 E
43-007-30222-00-00 UTAH 1-44 Gas Well P 1 15 S 9 E
43-007-30223-00-00 UTAH 1-45 Gas Well P 1 15 S 9 E
43-015-30330-00-00 UTAH 14-551 Gas Well P 14 16 S 8 E
43-015-30331-00-00 UTAH 14-552 Gas Well P 14 16 S 8 E
43-007-30239-00-00 UTAH 14-61 Gas Well P 14 15 S 9 E
43-007-30240-00-00 UTAH 14-62 Gas Well P 14 15 S 9 E
43-007-30241-00-00 UTAH 14-63 Gas Well P 14 15 S 9 E
43-007-30242-00-00 UTAH14-64 Gas Well P 14 15 S 9 E
43-015-30334-00-00 UTAH 15-553 Gas Well P 15 16 S 8 E
43-007-30416-00-00 UTAH 17-101 Gas Well P 17 15 S 10 E
43-007-30277-00-00 UTAH 17-102 Gas Well P 17 15 S 10
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Utah Well List as of 12/26/02

API Well Number Well Name Well Type Well Status Sec Twpn Twpd Rngn Rngd43-007-30255-00-00 UTAH 24-80 Gas Well P 24 15 S 9 E43-007-30256-00-00 UTAH 24-81 Gas Well P 24 15 S 9 E43-007-30267-00-00 UTAH 24-86 Gas Well P 24 15 S _ 9 i43-007-30375-00-00 UTAH 24-87 Gas Well P 24 15 S 9 E43-007-30227-00-00 UTAH 2-49 Gas Well P 2 15 S 9 E43-007-30157-00-00 UTAH 25-11-7 Gas Well P 25 14 S 9 E43-007-30399-00-00 UTAH 25-134 Gas Well P 25 15 S 9 E43-007-30400-00-00 UTAH 25-252 Gas Well P 25 15 S 9 E43-007-30401-00-00 UTAH 25-253
¯

Gas Well P 25 15 S 9 E43-007-30402-00-00 UTAH 25-254 Gas Well P 25 15 S 9 E43-007-30600-00-00 UTAH 25-389 Gas Well P 25 14 S 8 Ë43-007-30599-00-00 UTAH 25-390 Gas Well P 25 14 S 8 E43-007-30658-00-00 UTAH 25-391 Gas Well P 25 14 S T43-007-30602-00-00 UTAH 25-392 Gas Well P 25 14 S 8 E43-007-30206-00-00 UTAH 25-4-33 Gas Well P 25 14 S 9 È43-015-30519-00-00 UTAH25-577 Gas Well P 25 16 S 8 E43-007-30156-00-00 UTAH 25-7-6 Gas Well P 25 14 S 9 E43-007-30204-00-00 UTAH 26-11-25 Gas Well P 26 14 S 9 E43-007-30205-00-00 UTAH 26-1-23 Gas Well P 26 14 S 9 E43-007-30181-00-00 UTAH 26-16-8 Gas Well P 26 14 S 9 E
4 -30446-00-00 UTAH26-255 Gas Well P 26 15 S 9 E43-007-30445-00-00 UTAH 26-256 Gas Well P 26 15 S 9 E43-007-30444-00-00 UTAH 26-257 Gas Well P 26 15 S 9 E43-007-30514-00-00 UTAH 26-267 Gas Well P 26 15 S 9 E43-015-30541-00-00 UTAH 26-580 Gas Well P 26 16 S 8 E4fÕ15-30542-00-00UTAH 26-581 Gas Well P 26 16 S 8 E43-015-30544-00-00 UTAH 26-583 Gas Well P 26 16 S 8 E43-007-30202-00-00 UTAH 26-6-24 Gas Well P 26 14 S 9 E43-007-30395-00-00 UTAH 27-187 Gas Well P 27 14 S 9 E43-007-30292-00-00 UTAH 27-188 Gas Well P 27 14 S 9 E43-007-30457-00-00 UTAH T7-268 Gas Well P 27 15 S 9 E43-007-30458-00-00 UTAH 27-269 Gas Well P 27 15 S 9 E4¯§õÖÌ30712-00-00

UTAH 27-457 _ Gas Well P 27 14 S 5 E43-007-30714-00-00 UTAH 27-458 Gas Well P 27 14 S 8 E43-007-30777-00-00 UTAH 27-520 Gas Well P 27 14 S 8 E43-015-30545-00-00 UTAH 27-584 Gas Well P 27 16 S 8 E4¯ÑÖÕ¾30193-00-00
UTAH 27-8-29 Gas Well P 27 14 S 9 E43-007-30186-00-00 UTAH 27-9-30 Gas Well P

¯
27 14 S 9 E43-007-30396-00-00 UTAH 28-189 Gas Well P _ _ 28 14 S 9 E43-007-30397-00-00 UTAH 28-190 Gas Well P 28 14 S 9 E43-007-30293-00-00 UTAH 28-191 Gas Well P 28 14 S 9 E43-007-30294-00-00 UTAH 28-192 Gas Well P 28 14 S 9 E43-007-30551-00-00 UTAH 28-320 Gas Well P 28 15 S 9 E43-007-30560-00-00 UTAH 28-321 Gas Well P 28 15 S 9 E43-007-30405-00-00 UTAHZ9-193 Gas Well P 29 14 S 9 E43-007-30427-00-00 UTAH 29-194 Gas Well P 29 14 S 9 E43-007-30739-00-00 UTAH 29-339 Gas Well P 29 15 S 9 E43-007-30740-00-00 UTAH 29-340 Gas Well P 29 15 S 9 E4¯ŒÕÕ¯¯30741-00-00

UTAH 29-341 Gas Well P 29 15 S 9 E43-007-30742-00-00 UTAH 29-342 Gas Well P
¯29

15 S 9 E43-007-30262-00-00 UTAH 30-125 Gas Well P 30 14 S 10 E43-007-30185-00-00 UTAH 30-13-14
¯

Gas Well P 30 14 S 10 E43-007-30265-00-00 UTAH 30-195 Gas Well P 30 14 S 9 E43-007-30344-00-00 UTAH 30-196 Gas Well P 30 14 S 9 i
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¯

Gas Well P 30 14 S 10 E43-007-30265-00-00 UTAH 30-195 Gas Well P 30 14 S 9 E43-007-30344-00-00 UTAH 30-196 Gas Well P 30 14 S 9 i
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Utah Well List as of 12/26/02

API Well Number Well Name Well Type Well Status Sec Twpn Twpd Rngn Rngd
43-007-30178-00-00 UTAH 36-1-2 Gas Well P 36 14 S 9 E
43-007-30341-00-00 UTAH 36-135 Gas Well P 36 15 S 9 E
43-007-30343-00-00 UTAH 36-136 Gas Well P 36 15 S 9 E
43-007-30342-00-00 UTAH 36-137 Gas Well P 36 15 S 9 E
43-007-30315-00-00 UTAH 36-162 Gas Well P 36 14 S 8 E
43-007-30316-00-00 UTAH 36-163 Gas Well P 36 14 S 8 E
43-007-30317-00-00 UTAH 36-164 Gas Well P 36 14 S 8 E
43-007-30318-00-00 UTAH 36-165 Gas Well P 36 14 S 8 E
43-007-30144-00-00 UTAH 36-9-5 Gas Well P 36 14 S 9 E
43-015-30341-00-00 UTAH4-280 Gas Well P 4 16 S 9 E
43-015-30342-00-00 UTAH4-282 Gas Well P 4 16 S 9 E
43-007-30384-00-00 UTAH 5-205 Gas Well P 5 15 S 9 E
43-007-30269-00-00 UTAH 5-94 Gas Well P 5 15 S 10 E
43-007-30270-00-00 UTAH 5-95 Gas Well P 5 15 S 10 E
43-007-30271-00-00 UTAH 5-96 Gas Well P 5 15 S 10 E
43-007-30217-00-00 UTAH 6-38 Gas Well P 6 15 S 10 E
43-007-30218-00-00 UTAH 6-39 Gas Well P 6 15 S 10 E
43-007-30219-00-00 UTAH 6-40 Gas Well P 6 15 S 10 E
43-007-30254-00-00 UTAH 6-41 Gas Well P 6 15 S 10 E
43-007-30235-00-00 UTAH 7-57 Gas Well P 7 15 S 10 E
43-007-30236-00-00 UTAH 7-58 Gas Well P 7 15 S 10 E
43-007-30237-00-00 UTAH7-59 Gas Well P 7 15 S 10 E
43-007-30238-00-00 UTAH 7-60 Gas Well P 7 15 S 10 E
43-007-30275-00-00 UTAH 8-100 Gas Well P 8 15 S 10 E
43-007-30410-00-00 UTAH 8-230 Gas Well P 8 15 S 9 E
43-007-30272-00-00 UTAH 8-97 Gas Well P 8 15 S Ï0 E
43-007-30285-00-00 UTAH 8-98X Gas Well P 8 15 S 10 E
43-007-30274-00-00 UTAH 8-99 Gas Well P 8 15 S 10 E
43-007-30413-00-00 UTAH 9-228 Gas Well P 9 15 S 9 E
43-007-30414-00-00 UTAH 9-229 Gas Well P 9 15 S 9 E
43-007-30279-00-00 WILLIAMS30-78 Gas Well P 30 14 S iO E
43-007-30481-00-00 WOOLSTENHULME 05-266 Gas Well P 5 15 S 10 E
43-015-30250-00-00 UTAH 16-110 Gas Well Shut In 16 16 S 5
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If you have any questions,pleasecontact BillForbesat 703.440-1536.

Wilbert B. Forbes
Land LawExaminer
Branch of Use Authorization
DivisionofResourcesPlanning, Use
and Protection

bc: JFO. BLM State Offices, MMS, SS RF. 930 RF. ES-932:
Bforbes:wbf:01/16/03:440-1536/ConocoPhillips
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use thisform for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells,or to
drill horlzontal laterais. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER All
See Attached List

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:
Phillips Petroleum Company See List

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
980 Plaza Office my Bartlesville OK ,,,74004 (918) 661-4415

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: Sèe Attached List . COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

ii. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXESTO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Dupilcate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start: CASING REPAIR O NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE
SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFFDate of work completion:
O COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATFONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE -DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly showall pedinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Conoco Inc. was merged into Phillips Petroleum Company, the surviving corporation, on December 31, 2002. In connectionwith thismerger and effectiveon the same date, the name of the surviving corporation was changed to "ConocoPhillips
Company". We are requesting that a new Operator Number be assigned to ConocoPhillips Company.

Please send production reporting forms to Herb Henderson at ConocoPhillips Company, 315 S. Johnstone, 980 Plaza Office,
Bartiesville, OK 74004. Herb's phone number is 918-661-4415.

Current Operator New Operator
Phillips Petroleum Company ConocoPhillips Company RECElVED

JANOS2003
Steve de Albuq que olanda Perez

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Yolanda Perez
TITL6 Sr. Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
ir DATE 12/30/2002

(This space for Stato use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse
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ConocoPhillips

SECRETARY'S CERTIFICATE

I, the undersigned, Jennifer M. Garcia, Assistant Secretary of ConocoPhillips Company,
formerly Phillips Petroleum Company, organized and e×isting under and by virtue of the laws of
the State of Delaware (the"Corporation"), hereby certify that:

1. As Assistant Secretary I am authorized to e×ecute this certificate
on behalf of the Corporation.

2. The attached photocopy of the Certificate of Amendment to the
Restated Certificate of Incorporation of Phillips Petroleum
Company (to be renamed ConocoPhillips Company) is a true
and correct copy as filed in the officeof the Secretary of State of
Delaware on the 12 day of December 2002, with an effective
date of January 1, 2003 and such Certificate of Amendment has
not been modified, amended, rescinded or revoked and is in full
force and effect as of the date hereof.

3. The attached photocopy of the Certificate of Merger of Conoco
Inc. with and into ConocoPhillips Company is a true and correct
copy as filed in the office of the Secretary of State of Delaware
on the 12* day of December 2002, with an effective date of
December 31, 2002 and such Certificate of Merger has not been
modified,amended, rescinded or revoked and is in full force and
effect as of the date hereof.

IN WlTNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand as Assistant Secretary and
affixed the corporate seal of the Corporation this 7th day of January 2003.

Ass ecretary
o ocoPhillips Company

STATE OF TEXAS §
§

COUNTY OF HARRIS §

This instrument was acknowledged before me on January 7, 2003, by Jennifer M Garcia,
Assistant Secretary of ConocoPhillips Company, a Delaware corporation, on behalf of said

RECEIVED "" Not PubÌÏc

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&
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'The irst State

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF

DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATTACHED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT

COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT OF "PHILLIPS PETROLEUM

COMPANY", CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "PHILLIPS PETROLEUM COMPANY" TO

"CONOCOPHILLIPS COMPANY", FILED IN THIS OFFICE ON THE TWELFTH

DAY OF DECEM3ER, A.D. 2002, AT 1:41 O'CLOCK P.M.

AND I DO HEREBY FURTHER CERTIFY THAT THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF

THE AFORESAID CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT IS THE THIRTY-FIRST DAY

OF DECEMBER, A.D. 2002, AT 11 O'CLOCK P.M.

RECEIVED
JANO8 2003

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING

Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary of State

0064324 8100 AUTHENTICATION: 2183360

030002793 DATE:

PAGE 1

'The irst State

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF

DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATTACHED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT

COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT OF "PHILLIPS PETROLEUM

COMPANY", CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "PHILLIPS PETROLEUM COMPANY" TO

"CONOCOPHILLIPS COMPANY", FILED IN THIS OFFICE ON THE TWELFTH

DAY OF DECEM3ER, A.D. 2002, AT 1:41 O'CLOCK P.M.

AND I DO HEREBY FURTHER CERTIFY THAT THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF

THE AFORESAID CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT IS THE THIRTY-FIRST DAY

OF DECEMBER, A.D. 2002, AT 11 O'CLOCK P.M.

RECEIVED
JANO8 2003

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING

Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary of State

0064324 8100 AUTHENTICATION: 2183360

030002793 DATE:

PAGE 1

'The irst State

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF

DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATTACHED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT

COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT OF "PHILLIPS PETROLEUM

COMPANY", CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "PHILLIPS PETROLEUM COMPANY" TO

"CONOCOPHILLIPS COMPANY", FILED IN THIS OFFICE ON THE TWELFTH

DAY OF DECEM3ER, A.D. 2002, AT 1:41 O'CLOCK P.M.

AND I DO HEREBY FURTHER CERTIFY THAT THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF

THE AFORESAID CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT IS THE THIRTY-FIRST DAY

OF DECEMBER, A.D. 2002, AT 11 O'CLOCK P.M.

RECEIVED
JANO8 2003

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING

Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary of State

0064324 8100 AUTHENTICATION: 2183360

030002793 DATE:



O O
STATE OF DELANARE

FROMRL&F#l (THU)12.12'02 13:32/ST.13;&qW0c46649Wr¾fE S
DIVISION OF CORPORATIONS
FILZD 01:41 PM 12/12/2002

020763238 - 0064324

CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT

to the

RESTATED CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION

of

PHILLIPS PETROLEUM COMPANY
(to be renamed ConocoPhillips Company)

Phillips Petroleum Company ('Thillips"), a corporation organized and existing
under the General CorporationLaw of the State of Delaware (the "DGCL"), hereby certifies that:

1. The amendments to Phillips' Restated Certificate of Incorporation set
forth below were duly adopted in accordance with the provisions of Section 242 of the DGCL
and have been consented to in writing by the sole stockholder of Phillips in accordance with
Section 228 of the DGCL.

2. Phillips' Restated Certificate of Incorporation is hereby amended by
deleting Article I thereof and replacing in lieu thereof a new Article I reading in its entirety as
follows:

"The name of the corporation (which is hereinafter referred to as the
"Corporation")is ConocoPhillips Company."

3. Phillips' Restated Certificate of Incorporation is hereby amended by
deleting Section 1 of Article IV thereof and replacing in lieu thereof a new Section 1 reading in
its entirety as follows:

"Section 1. The Corporation shall be authorized to issue 2,100 shares of capital
stock, of which 2,100shares shall be shares of Common Stock, $.01par value ("Common
Stock")."

4. Pursuantto Section 103(d) of the DGCL, this amendment will become
effectiveat 11:00 p.m., Eastern time, on December 31, 2002.

HOUWW.1 RECEIVED
JANO8 2003

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&
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O O

United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Eastern States Office
7450 Boston Boulevard

Springfield, Virginia 22153

IN REPLY REFER TO
3106.8(932.34)WF January 16, 2003

NOTICE

ConocoPhillips Company : Oil & Gas Leases
P.O. Box 7500
Bartlesville, Oklahoma 74005

Merger/Name Change Recognized

Acceptable evidence was received in this office on January 14, 2003, concerning the change of
name of Phillips Petroleum Company to ConocoPhillips Company and the merger of Conoco
Incorporated into ConocoPhillips Company on Federal oil and gas leases, with
ConocoPhillips Company being the surviving entity.

The Secretary of the State of Delaware certified the effective date of this merger effective
December 31, 2002.

The oil and gas lease files identified on the enclosed exhibit have been noted to the merger. The
exhibit was compiled from a list of leases obtained from your list of leases. Eastern States has
not abstracted the lease files to determine if the entities affected by this merger hold an interest in
the leases identified nor have we attempted to identify leases where the entities are the operator
on the ground maintaining no vested record title or operating rights interest. We are notifying the
Minerals Management Service and all applicable Bureau of Land Management offices of this
merger and name change by a copy of this notice. If additional documentation for changes of
operator are required by our Field Offices, you will be contacted by them.

If you identify other leases in which the merging entity maintain an interest, please contact this
office and we will appropriately document those files with a copy of this Notice.

By Operation of law the name of the principal on Nationwide Oil and Gas Bond held by Conoco
Incorporated (ES0085) has been changed to ConocoPhillips
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O O
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET I. GLH
2. CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent/Operator

Operator Name Change X Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 12-31-02
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
PHILLIPS PETROLEUM COMPANY CONOCOPHILLIPS COMPANY
Address: 980 PLAZA OFFICE Address: PO BOX 2197, WL3 4066

BARTLESVILLE, OK 74004 HOUSTON, TX 77252
Phone: 1-(918)-661-4415 Phone: 1-(832)-486-2329
Account No. N1475 Account No. N2335

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)

SEC TWN API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL
NAME RNG NO TYPE TYPE STATUS
UTAH 31-612 31-16S-09E 43-015-30522 99999 STATE GW NEW
UTAH 31-613 31-16S-09E 43-015-30523 99999 STATE GW NEW
UTAH 31-614 31-16$-09E 43-015-30524 99999 STATE GW NEW
FEDERAL $1-29 29-09S-19E 43-047-33653 13077 FEDERAL GW P
FEDERAL 34-29 29-095-19E 43-047-33750 13174 FEDERAL GW P
FEDERAL 12-29-7-1 29-09S-19E 43-047-34471 99999 FEDERAL GW APD
FEDERAL 31-31-6-1 31.09S-19E 43-047-34472 99999 FEDERAL GW APD
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12-10S-17E 43-047-34286 13492 FEDERAL GW P
FEDERAL 43-24-3 #1 24-10$-17E 43-047-34551 99999 FEDERAL GW APD
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 07-105-18E 43-047-33983 13182 FEDERAL GW P
FEDERAL 12-17 #1 17-10S-18E 43-047-33982 99999 FEDERAL GW APD
FEDERAL 14-18-2 #1 18-10S-18E 43-047-34539 13491 FEDERAL GW P
ANTELOPE KNOLLS 21-23 # 1 23-10$-18E 43-047-34287 99999 FEDERAL GW NEW

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 01/08/2003

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 01/08/2003

3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 02/03/2003

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 562960-0143

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted
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6. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: 01/14/2003

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 01/14/2003

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: 01/14/2003

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,
for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 02/13/2003

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 02/13/2003

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: N/A

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: N/A

STATE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond Number: 8140-60-24

FEDERAL WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 8015-16-69

INDIAN WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A

FEE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 6196922

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: N/A

6. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE
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st 999) UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
OMB NO. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Expires: November 30, 2000

5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-76262

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an
abandoned well. Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. 6. lf Indian, Allottee or Tnbe Narne

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side. 7, If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

I Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.

O oilwell e oaswell O Other
FEDERAL 31-29(

2 Name of Operator Contact FRANKIEHATHAWAY 9. API Well No.

CONOCOPHILLIPS COMPANY E-Mail: Frankie.Hathaway@conocophillips con 43-047-33653

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

P. O. BOX 851 Ph: 435.613.9777 WILDCAT
PRICE, UT 84501 Fx: 435.613.9782

4. Location of Well (Footage. Sec. T. R.. M., or Surver Description) 11 County or Parish, and State

Sec 29 T9S R19E SWSE 682FNL 2042FEL UINTAH COUNTY, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMIS$lON TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent O Acidize O Deepen O Production (Start/Resume) O Water Shut-Off

O Alter Casmg O Fracture Treat 0 Reclarnation O Well Integrity

Subsequent Report O CasingRepair O New Construction O Recomplete g Other

O Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon
Production Start-up

O Convert to Injection O Plug Back O Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, includmg estirnated startmg date ofany proposed work and approximate duration thereof

If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete honzontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertment markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed withtn 30 days
followmg completion of the mvolved operations If the operation results m a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once

testing has been completed. Fmal Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, mcluding reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final mspection.)

Please be advised that the Federal 32-29 #1 well showed first production on 5/17/01:
gas: 1320 MCF
water: 251 bbl

RECElVED ' - *

FEB0 72003
Div.OFOIL,GAS&MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregomg is tiue and correct
Electronic Submission #18327 verified by the BLM Well Information System

For CONOCOPHILLIPS CO 41PANY,sent to the Vernal

Name(Printed/Tiped) FRANKIE HATHAWAY Title OPERATIONS CLERK

Signature (Electrome Subinission) Date 02/05/2003

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Apgoved_By
_ _ _ _

Title Date

Conditions of approval, it any, are attached. Appioval of this notice does not warrant or

certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those lights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon Office

Title 18 US C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S C Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowinglyand willfully to make to any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitious or flaudulent statements oi representations as to any matter withm its jurisdiction.

** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL

st 999) UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
OMB NO. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Expires: November 30, 2000

5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-76262

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an
abandoned well. Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. 6. lf Indian, Allottee or Tnbe Narne

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side. 7, If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

I Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.

O oilwell e oaswell O Other
FEDERAL 31-29(

2 Name of Operator Contact FRANKIEHATHAWAY 9. API Well No.

CONOCOPHILLIPS COMPANY E-Mail: Frankie.Hathaway@conocophillips con 43-047-33653

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

P. O. BOX 851 Ph: 435.613.9777 WILDCAT
PRICE, UT 84501 Fx: 435.613.9782

4. Location of Well (Footage. Sec. T. R.. M., or Surver Description) 11 County or Parish, and State

Sec 29 T9S R19E SWSE 682FNL 2042FEL UINTAH COUNTY, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMIS$lON TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent O Acidize O Deepen O Production (Start/Resume) O Water Shut-Off

O Alter Casmg O Fracture Treat 0 Reclarnation O Well Integrity

Subsequent Report O CasingRepair O New Construction O Recomplete g Other

O Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon
Production Start-up

O Convert to Injection O Plug Back O Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, includmg estirnated startmg date ofany proposed work and approximate duration thereof

If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete honzontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertment markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed withtn 30 days
followmg completion of the mvolved operations If the operation results m a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once

testing has been completed. Fmal Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, mcluding reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final mspection.)

Please be advised that the Federal 32-29 #1 well showed first production on 5/17/01:
gas: 1320 MCF
water: 251 bbl

RECElVED ' - *

FEB0 72003
Div.OFOIL,GAS&MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregomg is tiue and correct
Electronic Submission #18327 verified by the BLM Well Information System

For CONOCOPHILLIPS CO 41PANY,sent to the Vernal

Name(Printed/Tiped) FRANKIE HATHAWAY Title OPERATIONS CLERK

Signature (Electrome Subinission) Date 02/05/2003

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Apgoved_By
_ _ _ _

Title Date

Conditions of approval, it any, are attached. Appioval of this notice does not warrant or

certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those lights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon Office

Title 18 US C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S C Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowinglyand willfully to make to any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitious or flaudulent statements oi representations as to any matter withm its jurisdiction.

** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL

st 999) UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
OMB NO. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
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12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMIS$lON TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent O Acidize O Deepen O Production (Start/Resume) O Water Shut-Off

O Alter Casmg O Fracture Treat 0 Reclarnation O Well Integrity

Subsequent Report O CasingRepair O New Construction O Recomplete g Other

O Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon
Production Start-up

O Convert to Injection O Plug Back O Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, includmg estirnated startmg date ofany proposed work and approximate duration thereof

If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete honzontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertment markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed withtn 30 days
followmg completion of the mvolved operations If the operation results m a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once

testing has been completed. Fmal Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, mcluding reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the site is ready for final mspection.)

Please be advised that the Federal 32-29 #1 well showed first production on 5/17/01:
gas: 1320 MCF
water: 251 bbl

RECElVED ' - *

FEB0 72003
Div.OFOIL,GAS&MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregomg is tiue and correct
Electronic Submission #18327 verified by the BLM Well Information System

For CONOCOPHILLIPS CO 41PANY,sent to the Vernal

Name(Printed/Tiped) FRANKIE HATHAWAY Title OPERATIONS CLERK

Signature (Electrome Subinission) Date 02/05/2003

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Apgoved_By
_ _ _ _

Title Date

Conditions of approval, it any, are attached. Appioval of this notice does not warrant or

certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those lights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon Office

Title 18 US C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S C Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowinglyand willfully to make to any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitious or flaudulent statements oi representations as to any matter withm its jurisdiction.

** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL



O O
st 9 9) UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004-0135
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-76262

Do not use this form for proposals to dri/I or to re-enter an
abandoned well. Use form 3160-3 (APD} for such proposals. 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.
O Oil Well Gas Well O Other FEDERAL 31-29¥

2. Name of Operator Contact: FRANKIEHATHAWAY 9. API Well No.
CONOCOPHILLlPS COMPANY E-Mail: Frankie.Hathaway@conocophillips.con 43-047-33653

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or ExploratoryP. O. BOX851 Ph: 435.613.9777 RIVER BEND
PRICE, UT 84501 Fx: 435.613.9782

4. Location of Well (Footage. Sec., T. R., M., or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, and State

Sec 29 TO95 R19E NENW 682FNL 2042FEL UINTAH COUNTY, UT

l2. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent O Acidize O Deepen O Production (Start/Resume) O Water Shut-Off
O Alter Casing O Fracture Treat O Reclamation O Well Integrity

Subsequent Report
O Casing Repair O New Construction O Recomplete B Other

O Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon
O Convert to Injection O Plug Back O Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereofIfthe proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths ofall pertinent markers and zones.Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 daysfollowingcompletion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed oncetesting has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator hasdetermined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

The purpose of this Sundry Notice is to notifythe Bureau of Land Management Vernal Field Office ofthe method and means of water disposal for the Federal 43-24-3 No. 1 well. There are currently no vwater disposal wells associated with this project, therefore, the produced water from this well istrucked via Nebeker Trucking to Water Disposal inc., in Vernal, Utah,

RECEIVED

MARO4 2003
D\V.OF 00.. GAS &M\NING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Electronic Submission #18944 verifie : by the BLM Well Information System

For CONOCOPHILLIPS CO APANY, sent to the Vernal

Name(Printed/Typed) FRANKIE HATHAWAY Title AUTHORIZEDREPRESENTATIVE

Signature (Electronic Submission) Date 02/26/2003

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Apgoved By_
_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _

Titic Date
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Office
Title 18 U.S.C.Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C.Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowinglyand willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the UnitedStates any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL

O O
st 9 9) UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004-0135
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-76262

Do not use this form for proposals to dri/I or to re-enter an
abandoned well. Use form 3160-3 (APD} for such proposals. 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.
O Oil Well Gas Well O Other FEDERAL 31-29¥

2. Name of Operator Contact: FRANKIEHATHAWAY 9. API Well No.
CONOCOPHILLlPS COMPANY E-Mail: Frankie.Hathaway@conocophillips.con 43-047-33653

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or ExploratoryP. O. BOX851 Ph: 435.613.9777 RIVER BEND
PRICE, UT 84501 Fx: 435.613.9782

4. Location of Well (Footage. Sec., T. R., M., or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, and State

Sec 29 TO95 R19E NENW 682FNL 2042FEL UINTAH COUNTY, UT

l2. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent O Acidize O Deepen O Production (Start/Resume) O Water Shut-Off
O Alter Casing O Fracture Treat O Reclamation O Well Integrity

Subsequent Report
O Casing Repair O New Construction O Recomplete B Other

O Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon
O Convert to Injection O Plug Back O Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereofIfthe proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths ofall pertinent markers and zones.Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 daysfollowingcompletion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed oncetesting has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator hasdetermined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

The purpose of this Sundry Notice is to notifythe Bureau of Land Management Vernal Field Office ofthe method and means of water disposal for the Federal 43-24-3 No. 1 well. There are currently no vwater disposal wells associated with this project, therefore, the produced water from this well istrucked via Nebeker Trucking to Water Disposal inc., in Vernal, Utah,

RECEIVED

MARO4 2003
D\V.OF 00.. GAS &M\NING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Electronic Submission #18944 verifie : by the BLM Well Information System

For CONOCOPHILLIPS CO APANY, sent to the Vernal

Name(Printed/Typed) FRANKIE HATHAWAY Title AUTHORIZEDREPRESENTATIVE

Signature (Electronic Submission) Date 02/26/2003

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Apgoved By_
_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _

Titic Date
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Office
Title 18 U.S.C.Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C.Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowinglyand willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the UnitedStates any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL

O O
st 9 9) UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000
5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-76262
Do not use this form for proposals to dri/I or to re-enter an

abandoned well. Use form 3160-3 (APD} for such proposals. 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.
O Oil Well Gas Well O Other FEDERAL 31-29¥

2. Name of Operator Contact: FRANKIEHATHAWAY 9. API Well No.
CONOCOPHILLlPS COMPANY E-Mail: Frankie.Hathaway@conocophillips.con 43-047-33653

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
P. O. BOX851 Ph: 435.613.9777 RIVER BEND
PRICE, UT 84501 Fx: 435.613.9782

4. Location of Well (Footage. Sec., T. R., M., or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, and State

Sec 29 TO95 R19E NENW 682FNL 2042FEL UINTAH COUNTY, UT

l2. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent O Acidize O Deepen O Production (Start/Resume) O Water Shut-Off
O Alter Casing O Fracture Treat O Reclamation O Well Integrity

Subsequent Report
O Casing Repair O New Construction O Recomplete B Other

O Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon
O Convert to Injection O Plug Back O Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereofIfthe proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths ofall pertinent markers and zones.Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 daysfollowingcompletion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed oncetesting has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator hasdetermined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

The purpose of this Sundry Notice is to notifythe Bureau of Land Management Vernal Field Office ofthe method and means of water disposal for the Federal 43-24-3 No. 1 well. There are currently no vwater disposal wells associated with this project, therefore, the produced water from this well istrucked via Nebeker Trucking to Water Disposal inc., in Vernal, Utah,

RECEIVED

MARO4 2003
D\V.OF 00.. GAS &M\NING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Electronic Submission #18944 verifie : by the BLM Well Information System

For CONOCOPHILLIPS CO APANY, sent to the Vernal

Name(Printed/Typed) FRANKIE HATHAWAY Title AUTHORIZEDREPRESENTATIVE

Signature (Electronic Submission) Date 02/26/2003

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Apgoved By_
_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _

Titic Date
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Office
Title 18 U.S.C.Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C.Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowinglyand willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the UnitedStates any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL



O O
STATEOFUTAH FORM9

DEPARTMENTOFNATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

6. IF INDIAN.ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMFNT NAMË:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottorn-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill hOfi7Ontal laterais. Use APPLICATlON FOR PERMiT TO DRILLterm for such proposals.

1. (YPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER See Attached
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

ConocoPhillips Company See List
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOl., OR WILDCAT:

P.O. Box 2197, WL3 61 Houston TX .77252 (832) 486-2329

4. LOCA TION OF WELL

FOOTACES AT SURFACE: See Attached List COUNTY: Uinta

OTR/QTR, SECTION. TOWNSHlP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ^CIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit In Duplicato) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARilY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANCE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VFNT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WAf ER DISPOSAL
(Submít Orígínal Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Dato of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUClNG FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE -DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volurnes, etc

Gasco Energy, Inc. willbe the new Operator for the wells on the attached list effective January 1, 2004. Gasco Energy, Inc. is
registered to do business in Utah.

Current Operator ÑgâS New Operator ,

ConocoPhillips Cornpany Gasco .
fo ///

P. O. Box 2197, WL3 6106 14 Inverness Drive East, Suite H-236
Houston, TX 77252 Englewood, CO 80112 I\

WILLIAMRAINBOLT,ATTORNEY-IN-FACT

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Yolanda Perez TITLE Sr. Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE O ( DATE 2/27/2004

(This space for State use only)

MARI / 2004
(5/2000) (Sco Instructions on Reverse

O O
STATEOFUTAH FORM9

DEPARTMENTOFNATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

6. IF INDIAN.ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
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drill hOfi7Ontal laterais. Use APPLICATlON FOR PERMiT TO DRILLterm for such proposals.
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P.O. Box 2197, WL3 61 Houston TX .77252 (832) 486-2329

4. LOCA TION OF WELL
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CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
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O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE -DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volurnes, etc

Gasco Energy, Inc. willbe the new Operator for the wells on the attached list effective January 1, 2004. Gasco Energy, Inc. is
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NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Yolanda Perez TITLE Sr. Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE O ( DATE 2/27/2004

(This space for State use only)

MARI / 2004
(5/2000) (Sco Instructions on Reverse
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CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
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CHANCE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VFNT OR FLARE
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Dato of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUClNG FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:
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12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volurnes, etc

Gasco Energy, Inc. willbe the new Operator for the wells on the attached list effective January 1, 2004. Gasco Energy, Inc. is
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(This space for State use only)

MARI / 2004
(5/2000) (Sco Instructions on Reverse



Change of Operator
ConocoPhillips Company to Gasco Energy, Inc.

APi Well Number |Operator iWell Name Well Type Well Status Sec. Twpn Twpd Rngn Rngd |Qtr/Qtr Ft. NS ¡NS Ft. EW EW
43-047-33653-00-00 |CONOCOPHILLIPS COMPANY FEDERAL 31-29 Gas Well Producing Well 29 9 S 19 E ¡NWNE 682|N 2042 E
43-047-33750-00-00 |CONOCOPHILLIPS COMPANY FEDERAL 34-29 . Gas Well Producing Well 29 9 S

.
19 E SWSE 604|S 1999 E

43-047-33983-00-00 ICONOCOPHILUPS COMPANY FEDERAL 24-7 #1 Gas Well |Producing Well 7 10 S I 18 E SESW 624|S I 1920 W
43-047-34286-00-00 |CONOCOPHILLIPS COMPANY PETES WASH 23-12 #1 Gas Well Shut in 12 __ 10 S 17 E NESW 2282 S I 1792|W
43-047-34539-00-00 |CONOCOPHILLIPS COMPANY FEO 14-18-2 #1 Gas Well Producing Well 18. 10 S 18 E SWSW 839 S 465 W
43-047-34551-00-00 |CONOCOPHILLIPS COMPANY FED 43-24-3 #1 IGas Well IProducing Well 24! 10 S 17 E .NESE 1500 S . 1000 E

O
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From: "Mark Choury" <mchoury@gascoenergy.com>

To: "Earlene Russell (E-mail)" <earlenerussell@utah.gov>

Date: 3/31/04 7:35AM
Subject: Gasco Production Company, Gasco Energy, Inc. and Pannonian Energy, Inc.

Earlene,
I apologize for all the confusion surrounding the various names. The reason we changed the name of
Pannonian Energy, Inc. to Gasco Production Company was to eliminate the confusion. Gasco Production
Company is a whollyowned subsidiary of Gasco Energy, Inc. It is our intention to have Gasco Production
Company serve as our operating entityand we are in the process of having our bonding recognize the
name change whichwas effective February 24, 2004.

I hope thishelps. Ifyou need anythingelse, just let me
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Defaware
PAGE 1

'TÑefirst State

I, EARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARYOF STATE OF THE STATE OF

DELAWARE, DO BEREBY CZRTIFY THE ATTACBED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT

COPY OF TEE CERTIETCATE OF AMENDMENTOF "PANNDNIAN ENERGYINC.",

CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "PANNDNIAN ENERGY INC." TO "GASCO

PRODUCTIONCOMPANY", FILZD IN THIS OFFICE ON THE TWENTY-FDDRTH

DAY OF FEBRUARY, A.D. 2004, AT 12:43 O'CLOCK P.N.

A FILED COPY .0F THIS CZRTIFICATE BAS BZZN FORWARDEDTO THE

NEW CASTLE COUNTY RZCORDER OF DEEDS.

Harriet SmithWindsor. Secretary of State

2999291 8100 AurBENTICATror: 2963993

040133641 DATE: 03-02-04 RECE IVED

MAR3 1 2004
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&
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FEB.24..20Ô4M:27AM DIIL3Ô3-777-3823 NO.3783 Ÿ. 9
State of n.TMhb¾

seese of sence
muision corporam
lives 22:da at 02/24/2004
r¤ D 12:43 sw 02/24/200e

SRV Od01.U641 - 2899291 &X£
CERTIFICATE OF AMENEMENT

TO
Cr.RTHICATE OF INCORPORATION

OF
PAÑNONIAN ENERGYING

PannonianEnergy Inc., a colporation organizedandcristing under andby vitinoof theGmetal

Corporadan Law ofthe StateofDelswxe,

DOESHEREBYCERT1FY:

FEST: That pursuant to a writienconacatto actionby the Boardaf Directorsof Pannonian

Energy Inc., resoludanswere dulyadopted setting factba proposedamendumtof the

Certificateof Inoctporationof said corporation,declaringsaid amendmentto be

advisable and recommendingits mbmissionto the solestockholderIbr considstation

thereof.Theresolutionsettingforththeproposedamendmentis as foBowr

RESOLVED,thatthecertideateof Inoorparslionaf thiscorporationbe ammded

by abanging theFirstArticlethereofso dat, as maanded,saidAliicleshallbe and

read as follows:

The nameof the corpontionis

GASCOPRODUCrlONCOMPANY.

SECONIX That, thereafler,pursumt to resolation of its Board of Directors,the proposed

an-hunut was submittedto thesolo stuold»Iderof saidcorposadan for considcration

and said solostockholderapproved the amendinat by masas of a writion consent in

action.

THIRD: That saidainmuksent wasðaly adapted inaccorducewiththe provisions of Sectim

242 oftheGaucralCorporationLawofthostateofDelarato.

FOURTH:Thatthecapitalof said comparationshall notbe redmed imder orÞy reasonof said

nynr:rvlment.

INWIT.blESSWHE1ŒOF,said PanaanianEnergyfue y causedthisoenißcateto be signed
byW.KingGrant,anauthorízedoficer,this dayofF , .

Br
W. King t, ary

RECEIVED
MM3120011

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH
2
3

X Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent/Operator

Operator Name Change Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: gjg/ggg4
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2335-ConocoPhillips Company N2575-Gasco Production Co

PO Box 2197, WL3 6106 14 Inverness Dr E, Suite H236
Houston, TX 77252 Englewood, CO 80112-5625

Phone: 1-(832) 486-2329 Phone: 1-(303)483-0044

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)
NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL

NO TYPE TYPE STATUS
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-29 29 090S 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 07 100S 180E 4304733983 13182 Federal GW P
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 100S 170E 4304734286 13492 Federal GW S
FED 14-18-2 #1 18 100S 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal GW P
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 100S 170E 4304734551 13726 Federal GW P

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 3/17/2904

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 3/17/2004

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: . 3/8/2Ó04

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 5574403-0143

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

Gasco Prod Inland 0304 FORM
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O O
6. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM Not Yet BIA

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: n/a

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: .N/A

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 3/31/2004

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 3/31/2004

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: N/A

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: Ñ/A

S. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: n/a

6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: 3/29/2004

STATE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond Number: n/a.

FEDERAL WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: UTii233

INDIAN WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: W/a.

FEE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number n/a

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: N/A

COMMENTS:
2/24/2004 Pannonian Energy Inc. became Gasco Production Co
Received request to changeto Gasco Production Co rather than Pannonian Energy Inc.

Gasco Prod inland 0304 FORM
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Uni d States Department of the terior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT y pp og•

Utah State Office tN M EglÇÀ
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
http://www.blm.gov

lN REPLY REFER TO:
3106
(UT-924)

May 18, 2004

Memorandum

To: Vernal Field Office, Moab Field Office

From: Chief, Branch of Minerals Adjudication

Subject: Name Change Approval

Attached is an approved copy of the name change recognized by the Utah State Office. We have
updated our records to reflect the name change from Pannonian Energy Inc., into Gasco
Production Company is effective February 24, 2004.

lalRobertLopes

Robert Lopez
Chief Branch of
Minerals Adjudication

Enclosure
1. State of Utah Certificate of Registration

ec: MMS, Reference Data Branch, James Sykes, PO Box 225165, Denver CO 80225
State of Utah, DOGM, Attn: Earlene Russell, PO Box 145801, SLC UT 84114 RECElVED
Teyesa Thompson
Jod Incardine ggg 2001¡
Connie Seare

Q\V.OFOL GE
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lalRobertLopes

Robert Lopez
Chief Branch of
Minerals Adjudication

Enclosure
1. State of Utah Certificate of Registration

ec: MMS, Reference Data Branch, James Sykes, PO Box 225165, Denver CO 80225
State of Utah, DOGM, Attn: Earlene Russell, PO Box 145801, SLC UT 84114 RECElVED
Teyesa Thompson
Jod Incardine ggg 2001¡
Connie Seare

Q\V.OFOL GE



T 1.CX 1
'IRe irst State

I, HARRIET SHITH WINDSOR, SEÇRETARY OF STATZ OF THE STATE OF

DELAWARE, DO BEgBY CERTIFY TEE ATTACBEÔIS A TËUE AND CORRECT

COPY OF THE CZRTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT OF "PANNONIAN ENERGY INC.",

CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "PANNONIAN ENZRGY INC." TO "GASCO

PRODUCTION COMPANY", FILED IN THIS OFFICE ON THE TWENTY-FOURTH

DAY OF FEBRDARY, A.D. 2004, AT 12:43 O'CLOCK P.M.

A FILED COPY OF THIS CERTIFICATE BAS BEZN FORWARDED TO THE

NEW CASTLE COUNTY RECORDZR OF DEEDS.

Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretaryof State

2999291 8100 AUTBENTICATION: 2963993

040133641 DATE:
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O O
Gasco Production

api twsp rng sec well_name lease_num stat la_pa

4304734168 090S 190E 20 FED 24-20-9-19 UTU-75090 DRL

4304734169 090S 190E 20 FED 44-20-9-19 UTU-75090 DRL

4304734199 090S 190E 21 FED 23-21-9-19 UTU-78433 P

4304734608 090S 190E 21 FED 11-21-9-19 UTU-78433 DRL

4304735405 090S 190E 21 FED 42-21-9-19 UTU-78433 APD

4304735606 090S 190E 21 FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 UTU-78433 APD

4304734607 090S 190E 22 LYTHAMFED 22-22-9-19 UTU-78433 P

4304735404 090S 190E 22 FED 11-22-9-19 UTU-78433 DRL

4304733653 090S 190E 29 FEDERAL 31-29 UTU-76262 P e

4304733750 090S 190E 29 FEDERAL 34-29 UTU-76034 P

4304734111 090S 190E 29 FEDERAL 23-29 #1 UTU-76262 P

4304734202 090S 190E 29 FED 42-29-9-19 UTU-76262 P

4304735343 090S 190E 30 FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 UTU-37246 DRL

4304734201 090S 190E 31 FED 32-31-9-19 UTU-76489 P

4304735623 090S 190E 31 FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 UTU-019880A APD

4304735624 090S 190E 31 FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 UTU-019880A APD

4304734286 100S 170E 12 PETES WASH 23-12 #1 UTU-77063 P

4301332560 100S 170E 17 WILKINRIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 UTU-043615 APD

4304734551 100S 170E 24 FED 43-24-3 #1 UTU-74401 P

4304733983 100S 180E 07 FEDERAL 24-7 #1 UTU-68387 P

4304734539 1005 180E 18 FED 14-18-2 #1 UTU-74971 P

4304735808 100S 180E 22 FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 UTU-018260A APD

4304734924 100S 180E 30 FED 22-30-10-18 UTU-74408 APD

4304734813 1005 190E 06 FED 21-6-10-19 UTU-76490 LA 3/30/2004

4304731178 110S 200E 03 LAFKAS FED 1-3 U-34350 S

4304731818 110S 200E 05 WILLOW CREEK UNIT 2 U-39223 TA

4304731026 110S 200E 10 HILLFEDERAL 1-10 U-44089 TA

O O
Gasco Production

api twsp rng sec well_name lease_num stat la_pa

4304734168 090S 190E 20 FED 24-20-9-19 UTU-75090 DRL

4304734169 090S 190E 20 FED 44-20-9-19 UTU-75090 DRL

4304734199 090S 190E 21 FED 23-21-9-19 UTU-78433 P

4304734608 090S 190E 21 FED 11-21-9-19 UTU-78433 DRL

4304735405 090S 190E 21 FED 42-21-9-19 UTU-78433 APD

4304735606 090S 190E 21 FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 UTU-78433 APD

4304734607 090S 190E 22 LYTHAMFED 22-22-9-19 UTU-78433 P

4304735404 090S 190E 22 FED 11-22-9-19 UTU-78433 DRL

4304733653 090S 190E 29 FEDERAL 31-29 UTU-76262 P e

4304733750 090S 190E 29 FEDERAL 34-29 UTU-76034 P

4304734111 090S 190E 29 FEDERAL 23-29 #1 UTU-76262 P

4304734202 090S 190E 29 FED 42-29-9-19 UTU-76262 P

4304735343 090S 190E 30 FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 UTU-37246 DRL
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4304733983 100S 180E 07 FEDERAL 24-7 #1 UTU-68387 P

4304734539 1005 180E 18 FED 14-18-2 #1 UTU-74971 P

4304735808 100S 180E 22 FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 UTU-018260A APD
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- O O
Fonn 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 91,",

li;

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5 LeaseSerialNo
SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS "-76262

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enteran 6 If Indian,AllotteeorTribeName
abandoned well Use Form 3760-3 (APD) for such proposals NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Otherinstructions on reverse side. 7 IfUnitor CA/Agreement,Nameand/orNo.
NA1. Type of 11

OilWell GasWell Other 8. WellNameand Na
FEDERAL 31-292. NameofOperator Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a Address 3b. PhoneNo (include area code) 4304733653
14 Inverness Dr. East, Suite H-236, Englewood, CO 80112 303-483-0044 10.FieldandPool,or ExploratoryArea

4 1ocationofWell (Footage.Sec,T, R, M, orSurveyDescription) PARIETTE BENCH

682' FNL & 2042' FEL II. Countyor Parish, State
NWNE, SEC 29- S-R19E UINTAH COUNTY, UT

• 12. CIIECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES)TOINDICATE NATURE OFNGI1CE, REPORT, OROTIIER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Acidize Deepen Pro uction (Stad/Resume) Water Shut-Off
Noticeof Intent AlterCasing FractureTæat Reclamation WellIntegrity

SubsequentReport Casing Repair NewConstruction Recomplete Other
ChangePlans Plugand Abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convertto Injection PlugBack WaterDisposal

13 DescribeProposedor CompletedOperation (clearly stateall pertinentdetails,includingestimated starting dateof anyproposedwork and approximate duration th e
Iftheproposalistodeependirectionallyor recompletehorizontally,givesubsurfacelocationsandmeasuredandtruevedicaldepthsof all pertinentmarkers andzones
Attach the Bondunderwhich thework will beperformedor providetheBond No. on filewith BLM/BIA. Required subsequent repods shallbe filedwithin 30days
followingcompletionof theinvolvedoperations.Iftheoperationresultsina multiplecompletion or recompletion ina new intelval,a Form3160-4shallbefiledonce
testinghas beencompleted. Final AbandonmentNoticesshallbe filedonly after all requirements, includingreclamation, havebeencompleted, and theoperdtorhas
determinedthatthesite is ready forfinalinspection.)

Current Status:
Perfs: 12054.12060', 12010-12015'; CIBP @11,975' w/ 15' cmt; Perfs 11930-11936', 11856-11862', 11610-11620'; CIBP @11,580' wl l sz emt;
Perfs 11494-11497', 11383-11386',11278-11282', 11236-11239',10754-10757', 10724-10727', 10678-10682', 10,628-10,634',10014-10019'.

Scheduled Operation:
Recomplete in upper Dark Canyou and Wasatch, commingle with existing production. Perforate and frac the followingintervals:
Stage #1: 9162-65' Dark Canyon, 8992-98'Wasatch;
#2: 8622-30' Wasatch, 8520-28' Wasatch;
#3: 8396-402' Wasatch, 8215-20' Wasatch;
#4: 8096-106' Wasatch, 8010-14' Wasatch;
#5: 7018-37' Wasatch, 6910-18' Wasatch, 6609-28' Wassteh.

Estimate Starting Date: March 14, 2005 ) i r

THIS SUN R IS I
EWT

F INSUFFICIENT DATA WAS SUBMITTED TO APPROV_E TH
R649-3-22). ( AÑI 5 2 5

14. I hereby certify that the fore gggWych /f, v October 17, 2005
Name (Printed/Typed) taÍ¾ivisionof Oil, Gas aritl MiniWS

Anthony Sharp Title enior Engineer

Signa Dale 03/04/2005

IS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

&P2'°.Leg Title Date
Conditionsof approval,if any,areattached Approval of thisnotice doesnot warrant or
certify thatthe applicantholds legalorequitabletitleto thoserights in the subjectlease Office
which would entitletheapplicantto conductoperations thereon.
Title 18U.S.C.Section1001and Title43U.S.C.Section1212, make it a crimeforany person knowinglyand willfully to make to anydepartmen agency of the United
Statesany false, fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representations as to anymatter within ilsjurisdiction.
(Instructiom on page
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Dustir Jcet - Federal 31-29 Comming Page

From "Tony Sharp" <tsharp@gascoenergy.com>

To: "Dustin Doucet" <dustindoucet@utah.gov>

Date: 7/25/2005 3:15:44 PM
Subject: Federal 31-29 Commingle

Dustin, I got your phone message, and will see what is going on with
thisASAP.
Thanks.

Tony Sharp
Senior Engineer
Gasco Production Company
8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100
Englewood, CO 80012
tsharp@gascoenergy.com
Direct: 303-996-1823
Main: 303-483-0044
Cell:
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Form 3160-4 UNITw STATES FORM APPROVED

(August 1999) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires. November30, 2000

WELLCOMPLETIONORRECOMPLETIONREPORTANDLOG 5. Lease Serial No.
UTEL76262

la Type of Well O Oil Well Gas Dry Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
b Type of Completion New O workover O neeren O Plug Back DifT Resvr. NA

Other 7. lJnit or CA Agreement Name and No.

NA
2 Name of Operator

8 Lease Name and Well No
Gasco Production Compan.' Federal 3 I-29JT
3 Address 3a. Phone No (mclude area code) 9 API Well No.
8 Inverness 1)rive East Suite 100. Englewood. Colorado 80112 303-483-0044 043-047-33653
4 Location of Well (Report locanons clearly and m accordance wah Federed reqwrements) *

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
At surface 682' FNI. & 2042' FFI NW NE Pariette Bench

I 1 Sec., T., R., M., or Block and
At top prod interval reported below Survey or Area Sec 29-T9S-RI9F

12 County or Parish 13. State

At total depth Uintah litah
14 Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16 Date Completed 17. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)*

O oa^ U Readytorrou-Ol/l8/01 04/04/01 4846 KIš03/23/05
18 Total Depth. MD 12512 19. Plug Back T.D MD 12188 20. Death I ridge Plug Set MD

TVD 12512 TVD ]2\88 TVD
2 l. Type Electric & Other Mechamcal Logs Run (Submit copy ofeach) 22 Was well cored? No O Yes (Submit copy)

Was DST run? No O Yes (Submit copy)

Directional Survey? Ë No Yes (Submit copy)

23 Casing and Lmer Record (lieport all strings set m well)
Stage Ccmenter No of Sks. & Slurry Vol,Hole Size Size/Grade W1 (#/fi.) Top (MD) Bottom (MD) Cement Top* Amount PulledDepth Type of Cement (BBL)

7 7/8 4 1/2 P I 10 13.5 22 12465 3058 908 0
12 1/4 9 5/8 K-55 40 23 350 825 311 0
17 l/2 13 3/8 114( 45 24 22' 760 0

24 Tubing Record

Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Set (MD)
2 3/8" | 9286

25, Produemg Intervals 26. Perforation Record
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No Holes Perf Status
Mesaverde 10014 12060 10014-12060 0 45 264 Open

R) Mesaverde 8992 9166 8992-96: 9161-66'
.37 27 Open

pp Wasatch 6618 8706 6618-26.6896-6900:6914-18; .37 147 Open
D) 7020-24 7042-46, 8011-14; 8094-97: 8100-03; 8216-19; 8398-8401, 8523-27. 854 I-45; 8602-06, 8704-06'
a l I \ \ \
27 Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc.

Depth Interval Amount and type of Material
10014-12060 Frac Slimulate w/ACI rac 156000 & 35 PPG HYBOR
8992-9166 72250#20-40 Tempered LC sand using 1813 bbis WF & YF I 18 gel 0CT1 / 20058523-8706 76K# 20-40 lempered LC using 1785 bbis WF & YF \ 18 gel with Scalefrac in prepad
801 I-8401 74K# 20-40 Tcmpered LC using 1743 bbis WF & Yl- I 18 gel with Scalefrae in prepad
6896-7046 74648# 20-40 Tempered I C using 18343 bbis WF & YF I 18 gel DIV.OFOiL,GAS&MING
6618-6626 79464# 20-40 Tempered I C using 1205 bbis YF x-linked gel with Scalefrac in prepad

28. Production -Interval A
Date First Test Ilours rest Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Producnon Method
Produced Dale lested Production BBl MCF BRI Corr API Gravity

05/17/01 05/17/01 24 9 1,320 251 Flows from well
Choke Tbg Press Csg 24 Hr 04 Gas Water Oil Gravity Well Status
Size I-¡wg Press Rale BBL MCF BBL Corr API

50/64" SI 350 1120 9
28a. All Intervals
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Produchon BBL MCF BBL Corr API Gravity
03/23/05 03/24/05 24 N 0 609 237 Flowing

Choke Tbg Press Csg 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Oil Gravily Well Status
Size FIwg Press Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr API

16/64" si 66I 1131 9 O 609 237 On Production
(See instruchons and spaces for addinonal data on reverse

Form 3160-4 UNITw STATES FORM APPROVED

(August 1999) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires. November30, 2000

WELLCOMPLETIONORRECOMPLETIONREPORTANDLOG 5. Lease Serial No.
UTEL76262

la Type of Well O Oil Well Gas Dry Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
b Type of Completion New O workover O neeren O Plug Back DifT Resvr. NA

Other 7. lJnit or CA Agreement Name and No.

NA
2 Name of Operator

8 Lease Name and Well No
Gasco Production Compan.' Federal 3 I-29JT
3 Address 3a. Phone No (mclude area code) 9 API Well No.
8 Inverness 1)rive East Suite 100. Englewood. Colorado 80112 303-483-0044 043-047-33653
4 Location of Well (Report locanons clearly and m accordance wah Federed reqwrements) *

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
At surface 682' FNI. & 2042' FFI NW NE Pariette Bench

I 1 Sec., T., R., M., or Block and
At top prod interval reported below Survey or Area Sec 29-T9S-RI9F

12 County or Parish 13. State

At total depth Uintah litah
14 Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16 Date Completed 17. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)*

O oa^ U Readytorrou-Ol/l8/01 04/04/01 4846 KIš03/23/05
18 Total Depth. MD 12512 19. Plug Back T.D MD 12188 20. Death I ridge Plug Set MD

TVD 12512 TVD ]2\88 TVD
2 l. Type Electric & Other Mechamcal Logs Run (Submit copy ofeach) 22 Was well cored? No O Yes (Submit copy)

Was DST run? No O Yes (Submit copy)

Directional Survey? Ë No Yes (Submit copy)

23 Casing and Lmer Record (lieport all strings set m well)
Stage Ccmenter No of Sks. & Slurry Vol,Hole Size Size/Grade W1 (#/fi.) Top (MD) Bottom (MD) Cement Top* Amount PulledDepth Type of Cement (BBL)

7 7/8 4 1/2 P I 10 13.5 22 12465 3058 908 0
12 1/4 9 5/8 K-55 40 23 350 825 311 0
17 l/2 13 3/8 114( 45 24 22' 760 0

24 Tubing Record

Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Set (MD)
2 3/8" | 9286

25, Produemg Intervals 26. Perforation Record
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No Holes Perf Status
Mesaverde 10014 12060 10014-12060 0 45 264 Open

R) Mesaverde 8992 9166 8992-96: 9161-66'
.37 27 Open

pp Wasatch 6618 8706 6618-26.6896-6900:6914-18; .37 147 Open
D) 7020-24 7042-46, 8011-14; 8094-97: 8100-03; 8216-19; 8398-8401, 8523-27. 854 I-45; 8602-06, 8704-06'
a l I \ \ \
27 Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc.

Depth Interval Amount and type of Material
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(See instruchons and spaces for addinonal data on reverse
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28b.
Date First Test Hours Tes! Oil Gas Water Oil Gravily Gas Gravity Production Method

Producell Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr API

Choke Thg. Press Csg 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status

Size Ftwg. Press. Rale BBL MCF BBL Ratio

Sl

28c. Production - Interval I
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Produelion Method

Produced Date Tesletl Product on HHI. MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg Press Csg 24 lir Oil Gas Water Gas .Oil Well Status

Size Flwg. Press Rale BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

29. Disposition of Cas (Sold. used forfirel vented. etc]

30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation (l.og) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem
lests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, llowing and shut-in pressures
and recoveries.

Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name
Meas. Depth

Uinta 0 1,880 Shale Wasatch 5,398
Green River 1,880 5,350 Sandstone, limestone, shale Mesuverde 8,488
Wasatch 5,350 8,718 Sandstone, shale Mancos 12.22 \
Mesaverde 8,718 12.200 Sandstone, shale
Mancos 12,200 -

32. Additional remarks (include plugging procedure):

33. Circle enclosed attachments:

I. Electrical/Mechanical Logs (1 full set reg'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Report 4, Directional Survey
5. Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification 5. Core Analysis 7. Other:

36. l hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

Name (µ/easeprrát ßeverly Walker Title Engineering Tech

Signatu Date 10/13/2005

Titic 18 U.S C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

o U.S. GPO:
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United States Department of the Interior
6 BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

-. Vernal Field Office
- . 170 South 500 East Tagg pg¡og•

UCH Vernal, UT 84078 1NAMERICA
(435) 781-4400 Fax: (435) 781-4410

http://www.blm.covlutah/vernal
IN REPLY REFER TO:

3162.3
UTO8300

October 25, 2005

Mark Choury
Gasco Production Company
8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100 336 g 3
Englewood, Colorado 80112

Re: Well No. Federal 31-29 #1
NWNE, Sec. 29, T9S, R19E
Uintah County, Utah
Lease No. UTU-76262

Dear Mr. Choury:

This correspondence is in regard to the self-certificationstatement submitted requesting a
change in operator for the referenced well. After a review by this office, the change in operator
request is approved. Effective immediately, Gasco Production Company is responsible for all
operations performed on the referenced well. AIIliabilitywill now fall under your bond, BLM
Bond No. UT1233, for all operations conducted on the referenced well on the leased land.

Our records show that rights-of-way, UTU-77716& UTU-77745 have been issued for the off
lease portion of the road & pipeline to the subject well. In order for Gasco Production Company
to obtain the Bureau of Land Management's approval for the use of these rights-of-way, you
must have these rights-of-wayassigned over to Gasco Production Company. Please contact
Cindy McKee at 435-781-4434 for instructions on how to complete the assignment of the rights-
of-way.

If you have any other questions concerning this matter, please contact Leslie Wilcken of this
office at (435) 781-4497.

Sincerely,

Matt Baker
Petroleum Engineer

cc: UDOGM

RECEIVED
NOVO2 2005

DN.OFOlL,GAS&

United States Department of the Interior
6 BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
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DN.OFOlL,GAS&



Form3160-5
UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED(August 1999) OMB No 1004-0135DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expiresinovember30.2000

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-76262

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or reenter an 6 Irindian- Allottee or Tribe Nameabandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals· NA
1 if Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or NoSUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instruct¡ons on reverse sicie

I. Type of Well NA
Oil Well Gas Well O Other 8 Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator
Federal 31-29 #1Gasco Production Company 9 API Well No

3a Address 3b. Phone No. (inc/ude area code) 43-047-33653
8 Inverness Dr E, Englewood, Colorado 80112 303-483-¤¤44 lo Eield and root or Exploratory Area
4 Location of Well (Foolage. Sec . T. R . AL or Swver Description) Parje[É€ Ë€nCh

6Ñ2'I'NI, Ñ 2o42'FEL I I County or Parish. State
NW NE of Section 29-T9S-RigE

Uintah County, Utah
12. CIlECK APPROPRIATE IIOX(ES) TO INDICATI: NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT.OR OTilER DATA

TYPI' OF SUI3MISSION TYPE OF ACTION
Notice of Inten! Acidize Deepen Q Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Q Reclamation Well IntegrilySubscquent Report Casing Repair New Construction Q Recomplete Other( hange Plans Plug and Abandon Q Temporarily Abandon ( U/11)ITIÌC ]Ÿ)Cit'rFinal Abandonmen! Notice Convert to hijecIion Plug Back O Water Disposal
13 I)escnbe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent delaris, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereofIf the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete honzontally. give subsurtlice k)cations and measured and tme vertical depths of all pettinent markets and zonesAttach the liond under which the work will be performed or provide the liond No on file with fšLM/IllA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 daysfollowing completion of the involved operations If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Fomi 316(L4 shall be Gled oncetesting has been completed Final Abandonment Noliœs shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation have been completed. and the operalor hasdetermined that the site is ready for final inspection

This we/I is scheduled to have the sales meter calibrated on April 27, 2006 at to:15 a.nt

APR2 62006

14 I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/7yped) Title

Beverhi Walker Engineering Technician
Signature Date

/ April 20, 2006
/ THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval ifauv are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant or ()Íllcecertify that the apphcant holds legal or equitable title lo those nybis in the subject Icase
which would entitle the apphcant to conduct operat rons thereon

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 100L make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States anfalse, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
Elnstructions on reverse)

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining
For Record
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This we/I is scheduled to have the sales meter calibrated on April 27, 2006 at to:15 a.nt

APR2 62006

14 I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/7yped) Title

Beverhi Walker Engineering Technician
Signature Date

/ April 20, 2006
/ THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval ifauv are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant or ()Íllcecertify that the apphcant holds legal or equitable title lo those nybis in the subject Icase
which would entitle the apphcant to conduct operat rons thereon

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 100L make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States anfalse, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
Elnstructions on reverse)

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining
For Record

Form3160-5
UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED(August 1999) OMB No 1004-0135DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expiresinovember30.2000

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-76262
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/ THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE
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United States Department of the Interior 4
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Vernal Field Office
170 South 500 East TAKE PRIDE'
Vernal, UT 84078 INAMERICA

(435) 781-4400 Fax: (435) 781-4410
http://www.blm.govlutahlvernal

IN REPLY REFER TO:

3162.3
UTO8300

September 28, 2006

. John D. Longwell
Gasco Production Company
8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100
Englewood, Colorado 80112

Re: Well No. Federal 31-29
NWNE, Sec. 29, T9S, R19E
Uintah County, Utah
Lease No. UTU-76262

Dear Mr. Longwell:

This correspondence is in regard to the self-certificationstatement submitted requesting a
change in operator for the referenced well. After a review by this office, the change in operator
request is approved. Effective immediately, Gasco Production Company is responsible for all
operations performed on the referenced well. All liabilitywillnow fall under your bond, BLM
Bond No. UT1233, for all operations conducted on the referenced well on the leased land.

Our records show that a rights-of-way, UTU-77716 and UTU-77745 have been issued for the off
lease portion of the road and pipeline to the subject well. In order for Gasco Production
Company to obtain the Bureau of Land Management's approval for the use of these rights-of-
way, you must have these rights-of-wayassigned over to Gasco Production Company. Please
contact Cindy McKee at (435) 781-4434 for instructions on how to complete the assignment of
the rights-of-way.

Ifyou have any other questions concerning this matter, please contact Cindy Severson of this
office at (435) 781-4455.

Sincerely,

Matt Baker

RECEÅŸum Engineer

cc: UDOGM
Dominion E & P, Inc.

DIV.0F0lL,GAS&
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Form3160-5

so- I ) UNITx STATES FORM APPROVED
DEPARTMENTTF THE INTERI OMB No. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANA GEMEN Expires: November30, 2000

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELg|G242006 To"
'2N62

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.
7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No

1 Type of Well

il Well Gas Well ther 8. Well Name and No.

2 NameofOperator See Attached List
9. API Well No.

Gasco Production Company
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code)

8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100, Denver CO 80112 (303) 483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) Natural Buttes
I l. County or Parish, State

Uintah, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon Operator Change

O Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionallyor recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work willbe performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLMIBIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation resuKs in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Effective July 1, 2006, Gasco Production Company has purchased the wells listed on the attachment from:

Dominion Exploration & Production, Inc.
14000 Quail Springs Parkway, Suite 600
Oklahoma City, OK 73134

J n Garn - Asset Manager - Rocky Mountain Division

P ease be advised thatGasco Production Company is considered to be the operator of the wells on the attached list,
Lease #UTU-76262, Uintah County, and is responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease for the operations
conducted upon the lease lands. Bond coverage is provided by State Wide BLM Bond #UT1233.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct RECEIVED
Name (Prünedpped)

John D. Longwell / gg Title V.P. Operations

Signature Dit GFOll AAV ylaldate 8/10/2006

Approved by Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the
United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its
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Fonnn60-s UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-76262

Do not use ihis form for proposals to drill or to nNinferan 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3100-3 (APD) for sucle proposais.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No

I. Type of Well

Oil well Gas weli Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator See list below
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code)

8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 | 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage. Sec , T , R. M .

or Survey Description)

I1. County or Parish, Stale

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Siart/ Resume) Water Shui-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Inlegnty

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Nolice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. Describe Pmposed or CompletedOperations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any poposed work and approximate durationthereof
If the proposal is to deependirectionally or recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depthsof all pertinot markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performedor providethe BondNo on filewith BLM/BIA Required subsa¡uent reports shall be filed within 30days
followingcompletion of the involved operations. If theopemtion results in a multiple completion or recompidion ina new interval,a Form 31604 shall be Sledonce
testing has been completed Final Abandonment Notices shall be filedonly after all requirements, including reclamation, have bem completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready forfinal inspection.

This is to inform you that effective immediately we will be disposing of produced
water fromwells withim this lease as follows:

All produced water from this well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at the Desert Spring
SGaasceEurapdurca nC

n y
c1/p4ycofheeapnpr36vedpeR

fo I
shfacci

ity'rs a a
hl¥hich r owned b

The wells within this lease are:
Federal 12-29-9-19 SW NW of Sec 29-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-047-35614

Federal 23-29 #1 NE SW of Sec 29-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-047-34111

Federal 31-29 #1 NW NE of Sec 29-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah o43-047-33653 ENEDFederal 42-29-9-19 SE NE of Sec 29-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-047-34202 REC
OCT2 42006

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct ' gy g, 9As&WN\NG
Name (Printed 7pped)

Title
Beverly Walker,f Engineering Tech

Signature Date
October 18, 2006

/ / THISSPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant os
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, lictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page

Fonnn60-s UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
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13. Describe Pmposed or CompletedOperations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any poposed work and approximate durationthereof
If the proposal is to deependirectionally or recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depthsof all pertinot markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performedor providethe BondNo on filewith BLM/BIA Required subsa¡uent reports shall be filed within 30days
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All produced water from this well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at the Desert Spring
SGaasceEurapdurca nC
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14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct ' gy g, 9As&WN\NG
Name (Printed 7pped)

Title
Beverly Walker,f Engineering Tech

Signature Date
October 18, 2006

/ / THISSPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant os
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, lictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
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Final Abandonment Nolice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. Describe Pmposed or CompletedOperations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any poposed work and approximate durationthereof
If the proposal is to deependirectionally or recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depthsof all pertinot markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performedor providethe BondNo on filewith BLM/BIA Required subsa¡uent reports shall be filed within 30days
followingcompletion of the involved operations. If theopemtion results in a multiple completion or recompidion ina new interval,a Form 31604 shall be Sledonce
testing has been completed Final Abandonment Notices shall be filedonly after all requirements, including reclamation, have bem completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready forfinal inspection.

This is to inform you that effective immediately we will be disposing of produced
water fromwells withim this lease as follows:

All produced water from this well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at the Desert Spring
SGaasceEurapdurca nC

n y
c1/p4ycofheeapnpr36vedpeR

fo I
shfacci

ity'rs a a
hl¥hich r owned b

The wells within this lease are:
Federal 12-29-9-19 SW NW of Sec 29-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-047-35614

Federal 23-29 #1 NE SW of Sec 29-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-047-34111

Federal 31-29 #1 NW NE of Sec 29-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah o43-047-33653 ENEDFederal 42-29-9-19 SE NE of Sec 29-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-047-34202 REC
OCT2 42006

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct ' gy g, 9As&WN\NG
Name (Printed 7pped)

Title
Beverly Walker,f Engineering Tech

Signature Date
October 18, 2006

/ / THISSPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant os
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, lictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page



API Well No: 43047336530000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-76262 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 FEDERAL 31-29 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 PARIETTE BENCH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0682 FNL 2042 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

5/15/2010

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Gasco suspects there is a hole in the tubing. We are planning to move a
workover rig out to repair it.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Jessica Berg

TITLE
 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 4/26/2010

PHONE NUMBER:
303 483-0044  Ext 

 

PHONE NUMBER
303 996-1805

May 03, 2010

iPI Well No: 43047336530000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 31-29

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext PARIETTE BENCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0682 FNL 2042 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.05 Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

5/15/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco suspects there is a hole in the tubing. We are planning to move a
WOrkover rig out to repair it. Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: Ma 03,, 20

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A

iPI Well No: 43047336530000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 31-29

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext PARIETTE BENCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0682 FNL 2042 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.05 Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

5/15/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco suspects there is a hole in the tubing. We are planning to move a
WOrkover rig out to repair it. Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: Ma 03,, 20

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A

iPI Well No: 43047336530000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 31-29

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext PARIETTE BENCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0682 FNL 2042 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.05 Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

5/15/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco suspects there is a hole in the tubing. We are planning to move a
WOrkover rig out to repair it. Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: Ma 03,, 20

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



API Well No: 43047336530000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-76262 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 FEDERAL 31-29 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 PARIETTE BENCH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0682 FNL 2042 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

1/1/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Gasco would like to dispose of water at Integrated Water management, LLC
state approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 30, 2 south

Range 4 west in North Blue Bench UT. This facility would be used in addition
to the currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose of

water from this well.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Jessica Berg 303 996-1805

TITLE
 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 12/31/2010

December 31, 2010

01/05/2011

iPI Well No: 43047336530000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEASE D6E2sIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 31-29

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext PARIETTE BENCH

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0682 FNL 2042 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.05 Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

1/1/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco would like to dispose of water at Integrated Water management, LLC
state approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 30, 2 south Accepted by the

Range 4 west in North Blue Bench UT. This facility would be used in additiolUtah Division of
to the currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose il, Gas and Mining

water from this well. FOR REGORO(OINLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 12/31/2010

RECEIVED December 31,

iPI Well No: 43047336530000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEASE D6E2sIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 31-29

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext PARIETTE BENCH

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0682 FNL 2042 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.05 Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

1/1/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco would like to dispose of water at Integrated Water management, LLC
state approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 30, 2 south Accepted by the

Range 4 west in North Blue Bench UT. This facility would be used in additiolUtah Division of
to the currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose il, Gas and Mining

water from this well. FOR REGORO(OINLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 12/31/2010

RECEIVED December 31,

iPI Well No: 43047336530000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEASE D6E2sIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 31-29

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext PARIETTE BENCH

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0682 FNL 2042 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.05 Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

1/1/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco would like to dispose of water at Integrated Water management, LLC
state approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 30, 2 south Accepted by the

Range 4 west in North Blue Bench UT. This facility would be used in additiolUtah Division of
to the currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose il, Gas and Mining

water from this well. FOR REGORO(OINLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 12/31/2010

RECEIVED December 31,



RECEIVED: Apr. 10, 2014

                           FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-76262 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 FEDERAL 31-29 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 996-1805  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 PARIETTE BENCH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0682 FNL 2042 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

4 /28 /2014

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The Fed 31-29 is a gas well currently producing from the Mesaverde
and Wasatch formations. Gasco intends to plug back and TA the current
productive zones by setting a Cast Iron Bridge Plug at 5500' with 100'

of cement. Perforate the A-Sand in the Wasatch formation from
5382-5392. Fracture stimulate with 500 bbls fluid and 40000 lbs

20/40 sand. Swab test interval. If oil is found, run tbg and rods and set
pumping unit with an ajax engine on location. If swab test result is gas,

drill up bridge plug and put gas well back on production.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Jessica Berg 303 996-1805

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 4 /10 /2014

April 10, 2014

Sundry Number: 49856 API Well Number: 43047336530000Sundry Number: 49856 API Well Number: 43047336530000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-76262

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 31-29

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 996-1805 Ext PARIETTE BENCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0682 FNL 2042 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

4/28/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The Fed 31-29 is a gas well currently producing from the Mesaverde Accepted by the
and Wasatch formations. Gasco intends to plug back and TA the current utah Division of

productive zones by setting a Cast Iron Bridge Plug at 5500' with 100' oil, Gas and Mining

of cement. Perforate the A-Sand in the Wasatch formation from Date: April 10, 2014
5382-5392. Fracture stimulate with 500 bbls fluid and 40000 lbs

20/40 sand. Swab test interval. If oil is found, run tbg and rods and set sy: \ As/\È
pumping unit with an ajax engine on location. If swab test result is gas,

drill up bridge plug and put gas well back on production.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 4/10/2014

RECEIVED: Apr. 10,

Sundry Number: 49856 API Well Number: 43047336530000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-76262

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 31-29

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 996-1805 Ext PARIETTE BENCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0682 FNL 2042 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

4/28/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The Fed 31-29 is a gas well currently producing from the Mesaverde Accepted by the
and Wasatch formations. Gasco intends to plug back and TA the current utah Division of

productive zones by setting a Cast Iron Bridge Plug at 5500' with 100' oil, Gas and Mining

of cement. Perforate the A-Sand in the Wasatch formation from Date: April 10, 2014
5382-5392. Fracture stimulate with 500 bbls fluid and 40000 lbs

20/40 sand. Swab test interval. If oil is found, run tbg and rods and set sy: \ As/\È
pumping unit with an ajax engine on location. If swab test result is gas,

drill up bridge plug and put gas well back on production.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 4/10/2014

RECEIVED: Apr. 10,

Sundry Number: 49856 API Well Number: 43047336530000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-76262

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 31-29

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 996-1805 Ext PARIETTE BENCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0682 FNL 2042 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

4/28/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The Fed 31-29 is a gas well currently producing from the Mesaverde Accepted by the
and Wasatch formations. Gasco intends to plug back and TA the current utah Division of

productive zones by setting a Cast Iron Bridge Plug at 5500' with 100' oil, Gas and Mining

of cement. Perforate the A-Sand in the Wasatch formation from Date: April 10, 2014
5382-5392. Fracture stimulate with 500 bbls fluid and 40000 lbs

20/40 sand. Swab test interval. If oil is found, run tbg and rods and set sy: \ As/\È
pumping unit with an ajax engine on location. If swab test result is gas,

drill up bridge plug and put gas well back on production.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 4/10/2014

RECEIVED: Apr. 10,



RECEIVED: Apr. 10, 2014

  

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43047336530000

A 100' cement plug shall also be placed at approximately 8800' to isolate the Mesaverde
formation. 

Sundry Number: 49856 API Well Number: 43047336530000Sundry Number: 49856 API Well Number: 43047336530000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources
Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

OTI. GAS N1NTNG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43047336530000

A 100' cement plug shall also be placed at approximately 8800' to isolate the Mesaverde
formation.

RECEIVED: Apr. 10,

Sundry Number: 49856 API Well Number: 43047336530000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources
Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

OTI. GAS N1NTNG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43047336530000

A 100' cement plug shall also be placed at approximately 8800' to isolate the Mesaverde
formation.

RECEIVED: Apr. 10,

Sundry Number: 49856 API Well Number: 43047336530000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices
OTI. GAS N1NTNG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43047336530000

A 100' cement plug shall also be placed at approximately 8800' to isolate the Mesaverde
formation.

RECEIVED: Apr. 10,



RECEIVED: May. 08, 2014

                           FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-76262 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 FEDERAL 31-29 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 996-1805  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 PARIETTE BENCH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0682 FNL 2042 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

5 /20 /2014

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The Fed 31-29 is a gas well currently producing from the Mesaverde
and Wasatch formations. Gasco intends to test an additional zone in the

Wasatch formation with the following procedure: Set a temporary
bridge plug at 5600'. Perforate the Wasatch formation from

5382'-5392'. Fracture stimulate with 500 bbls fluid and 40000 lbs
20/40 sand. Return well to production to test new interval.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Jessica Berg 303 996-1805

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 5 /8 /2014

May 15, 2014

Sundry Number: 50912 API Well Number: 43047336530000Sundry Number: 50912 API Well Number: 43047336530000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-76262

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 31-29

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 996-1805 Ext PARIETTE BENCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0682 FNL 2042 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

5/20/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The Fed 31-29 is a gas well currently producing from the Mesaverde Accepted by the
and Wasatch formations. Gasco intends to test an additional zone in the utah Division of

Wasatch formation with the following procedure: Set a temporary "'Qn ining

bridge plug at 5600'. Perforate the Wasatch formation from Date:
53822' 543092'anFdracteurenstimulate huc5 Onbbo ef id and 4e0r000 lbs

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/8/2014

RECEIVED: May. 08,

Sundry Number: 50912 API Well Number: 43047336530000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-76262

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 31-29

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 996-1805 Ext PARIETTE BENCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0682 FNL 2042 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

5/20/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The Fed 31-29 is a gas well currently producing from the Mesaverde Accepted by the
and Wasatch formations. Gasco intends to test an additional zone in the utah Division of

Wasatch formation with the following procedure: Set a temporary "'Qn ining

bridge plug at 5600'. Perforate the Wasatch formation from Date:
53822' 543092'anFdracteurenstimulate huc5 Onbbo ef id and 4e0r000 lbs

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/8/2014

RECEIVED: May. 08,

Sundry Number: 50912 API Well Number: 43047336530000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-76262

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 31-29

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 996-1805 Ext PARIETTE BENCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0682 FNL 2042 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

5/20/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The Fed 31-29 is a gas well currently producing from the Mesaverde Accepted by the
and Wasatch formations. Gasco intends to test an additional zone in the utah Division of

Wasatch formation with the following procedure: Set a temporary "'Qn ining

bridge plug at 5600'. Perforate the Wasatch formation from Date:
53822' 543092'anFdracteurenstimulate huc5 Onbbo ef id and 4e0r000 lbs

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/8/2014

RECEIVED: May. 08,



RECEIVED: Jul. 25, 2014

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-76262 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 FEDERAL 31-29 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 996-1805  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 PARIETTE BENCH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0682 FNL 2042 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

6 /13 /2014

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Gasco completed an additional zone in the Wasatch formation by
setting a bridge plug at 5500', perforating and fracture stimulating the
well from 5382'-5392' with 593 bbls 15# Delta-140 gelled/crosslinked

fluid and flushed with 80 bbls 2% kcl. A wellbore schematic has been
attached detailing the workover. Gasco intends to temporarily test this

zone before drilling the bridge plug and returning the well to
commingled production from the Mesaverde and Wasatch. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Jessica Berg 303 996-1805

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 7 /25 /2014

August 21, 2014

Sundry Number: 53820 API Well Number: 43047336530000Sundry Number: 53820 API Well Number: 43047336530000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-76262

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 31-29

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 996-1805 Ext PARIETTE BENCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0682 FNL 2042 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

6/13/2014
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco completed an additional zone in the Wasatch formation by Accepted by the
setting a bridge plug at 5500', perforating and fracture stimulating the Utah Division of
well from 5382'-5392' with 593 bbls 15# Delta-140 gelled/crosslinked Oil, Gas and Mining

fluid and flushed with 80 bbls 2% kcl. A wellbore schematic has been FOR RECORD ONLY
attached detailing the workover. Gasco intends to temporarily test this August 21, 2014

zone before drilling the bridge plug and returning the well to
commingled production from the Mesaverde and Wasatch.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 7/25/2014

RECEIVED: Jul. 25,

Sundry Number: 53820 API Well Number: 43047336530000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-76262

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 31-29

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 996-1805 Ext PARIETTE BENCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0682 FNL 2042 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

6/13/2014
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco completed an additional zone in the Wasatch formation by Accepted by the
setting a bridge plug at 5500', perforating and fracture stimulating the Utah Division of
well from 5382'-5392' with 593 bbls 15# Delta-140 gelled/crosslinked Oil, Gas and Mining

fluid and flushed with 80 bbls 2% kcl. A wellbore schematic has been FOR RECORD ONLY
attached detailing the workover. Gasco intends to temporarily test this August 21, 2014

zone before drilling the bridge plug and returning the well to
commingled production from the Mesaverde and Wasatch.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 7/25/2014

RECEIVED: Jul. 25,

Sundry Number: 53820 API Well Number: 43047336530000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-76262

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 31-29

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 996-1805 Ext PARIETTE BENCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0682 FNL 2042 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

6/13/2014
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco completed an additional zone in the Wasatch formation by Accepted by the
setting a bridge plug at 5500', perforating and fracture stimulating the Utah Division of
well from 5382'-5392' with 593 bbls 15# Delta-140 gelled/crosslinked Oil, Gas and Mining

fluid and flushed with 80 bbls 2% kcl. A wellbore schematic has been FOR RECORD ONLY
attached detailing the workover. Gasco intends to temporarily test this August 21, 2014

zone before drilling the bridge plug and returning the well to
commingled production from the Mesaverde and Wasatch.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 7/25/2014

RECEIVED: Jul. 25,



RECEIVED: Aug. 04, 2014

As of 6/13/2014
LEASE: UTU-76262
FIELD:

LOCATION:
COUNTY: API:

GL: 4,832'
SIZE: KB: 4,848'
WT/GRD: SPUD DATE:
WT/GRD: COMP DATE:
CSA:
SX:
CIRC:
TOC:
HOLE SIZE:

SIZE:
WT/GRD:
WT/GRD:
CSA:
SX:

CIRC:
TOC:
HOLE SIZE:

SIZE:
WT/GRD:
WT/GRD:
CSA:
SX:

CIRC:
TOC:
HOLE SIZE:

WELL #: Federal 31-29 #1
Riverbend

682' FNL & 2042' FEL 
Uintah ST: Utah 43-047-33653

CONDUCTOR
13 3/8"
H-40
48#
222'

260 sx Class G
Y

Surf
17 1/2"

SURFACE CASING
9 5/8"
K-55
36#

3,571
465 sx Hi-Fill

460 sx Class G
Y

Y

Surf
12 1/4"

PRODUCTION CASING
4 1/2"

7 7/8"

Stimulation

P-110
13.5#
12,645

3058 sx Class G

CIBP @ 11,975' w/ 15' cement

CIBP @ 11,580' w/ 1 sack cement

Fish @ 11,280' consists of 130' of scaled tubing scaled in the 
hole

Temporary CIBP @ 5,500' (5/28/2014)

Tubing Detail: 173 jnts 2 3/8” EUE 8rnd 4.7# N-80 tbg + 4 ½” 
TAC + 2 jnts 2 3/8” EUE 8rnd 4.7# N-80 tbg + PSN + 4’x2 3/8” 
EUE 8rnd J-55 perf sub + bullet nosed jnt 2 3/8” EUE 8rnd 4.7# 

J-55 tbg. TAC @ 5,347’, PSN @ 5,416’, EOT @ 5,452’. 
(6/9/2014)

Rod Detail: 1 ¼” x 22’ polish rod + 1 @ 4’ 7/8” pony rod + 1 
@ 6’ 7/8” pony rod + 71 @ 7/8” guided rods (4 guides per rod) 
+ 135 @ ¾” guided rods (4 guides per rod) + 10 @ 1 ¼” K bars 

+ 2”x1 ½”x16 RHAC pump. (6/13/2014)

Surface

Stage 9: 
5/30/2014

= = 5382-92 Stage 9 - Wasatch

Stage 8: 
3/18/2005

= = 6618-26 Stage 8 - Wasatch

Stage 7: 
3/18/2005 = = 6896-900 6914-18 Stage 7 - Wasatch

= = 7020-24 Stage 7 - Wasatch
= = 7042-46 Stage 7 - Wasatch

Stage 6:
3/17/2005 = = 8011-14 8094-97 Stage 6 - Wasatch

= = 8100-03 8216-19 Stage 6 - Wasatch
= = 8398-401 Stage 6 - Wasatch

Stage 5:
3/17/2005 = = 8523-27 8541-45 Stage 5 - Wasatch

= = 8602-06 Stage 5 - Wasatch
= = 8704-06 Stage 5 - Wasatch

 
Stage 4:

3/16/2005 = = 8992-96 Stage 4 - Dark Canyon
= = 9161-66 Stage 4 - Dark Canyon

Stage 1,2,3: = = 10014-19 10628-34 Stage 3 - Lower Mesaverde
= = 10678-82 10724-27 Stage 3 - Lower Mesaverde
= = 10754-57 11236-39 Stage 3 - Lower Mesaverde
= = 11278-82 11383-86 Stage 3 - Lower Mesaverde
= = 11494-97 Stage 3 - Lower Mesaverde

= = 11610-20 Stage 2 - Lower Mesaverde
= = 11856-62 Stage 2 - Lower Mesaverde
= = 11930-36 Stage 2 - Lower Mesaverde

= = 12010-15 Stage 1 - Lower Mesaverde
= = 12054-60 Stage 1 - Lower Mesaverde

Revised By Date
KTM 7/17/2014 MD

79464# 20/40 Tempered LC using 1205 YF x-
linked gel w/ scalefrac in prepad

74,648# 20/40 Tempered LC using 1834 bbls WF 
& YF 118 gel 

74,000# Tempered LC using 1743 bbls WF & YF 
118 gel w/ scalefrac in prepad

CIBP @
5,500'

CIBP @
11,580'

CIBP @

Frac well w/ 50,000# 20/40 white sand, 17 bbls FR 
slick water, 593 bbls 15# Delta-140 gelled / 

crosslinked fluid, and flushed w/80 bbls 2% KCl

11,975'

12,512

76,000# 20/40 Tempered LC using 1785 bbls WF 
& YF 118 ge w/ scalefrac in prepad

72,250# 20/40 Tempered LC sand using 1813 bbls 
WF & YF 118 gel

Frac stimulate w/ ACFrac PR6000 & 35 PPG 
Hybor

Sundry Number: 53820 API Well Number: 43047336530000Sundry Number: 53820 API Well Number: 43047336530000

As of 6/13/2014
LEASE: UTU-76262 MELL #: Federal 31-29 #1
FIELD: Riverbend

LOCATION: 682' FNL & 2042' FEL
COUNTY: Uintah ST: Utah API: 43-047-33653

CONDUCTOR GL: 4,832'
SIZE: 13 3/8" I I KB: 4,848'
WT/GRD: H-40 SPUD DATE:
WT/GRD: 48# COMP DATE:
CSA: 222'
SX: 260 sx Class G
CIRC: Y I I
TOC: Surf CIBP @ 11,975' w/ 15' cement
HOLE SIZE: 17 1/2"

I I
SURFACE CASING

SIZE: 9 5/8" I I CIBP @11,580' w/ 1 sack cement
WT/GRD: K-55

WT/GRD: 36#
CSA: 3,571 I I
SX: 465 sx Hi-Fill Fish @11,280' consists of 130' of scaled tubing scaled in the

460 sx Class G hole
CIRC: Y
TOC: Surf
HOLE SIZE: 12 1/4"

Temporary CIBP @5,500' (5/28/2014)
PRODUCTION CASING

SIZE: 4 1/2"
WT/GRD: P-110

Tubing Detail: 173 jnts 2 3/8" EUE 8md 4.7#N-80 tbg + 4 ½"
WT/GRD: 13.5# TAC + 2 jnts 2 3/8" EUE 8md 4.7#N-80 tbg + PSN + 4'x2 3/8"

3058 s
6C45ass

G
EUE 8md J-55 perf sub + bullet nosed jnt 2 3/8" EUE 8md 4.7#

J-55 tbg. TAC @5,347', PSN @5,416', EOT @5,452'.

CIRC: Y (6/9/2014)

TOC: Surface
HOLE SIZE: 7 7/8"

Rod Detail: 1 ¼" x 22' polish rod + 1 @4' 7/8" pony rod + 1
@6' 7/8" pony rod + 71 @7/8" guided rods (4 guides per rod)

Stimulation + 135 @¾" guided rods (4 guides per rod) + 10 @1 ¼" K bars
+ 2"x1 ½"x16 RHAC pump. (6/13/2014)

Stage 9:
5/30/2014

Frac well w/ 50,000# 20/40 white sand, 17 bbls FR
slick water, 593 bbls 15# Delta-140 gelled/

crosslinked fluid, and flushed w/80 bbls 2% KCl
= = 5382-92 Stage 9 -Wasatch

Stage 8: CIBP @
3/18/2005 79464# 20/40 Tempered LC using 1205 YF x- 5,500

linked gel w/ scalefrac inprepad = = 6618-26 Stage 8 -Wasatch

Stage 7:
3/18/2005 74,648# 20/40 Tempered LC using l834 bbls WF = = 6896-900 6914-18 Stage 7 -Wasatch

& YF 118 gel = = 7020-24 Stage 7 -Wasatch
= = 7042-46 Stage 7 -Wasatch

Stage 6:
3/17/2005 74,000# Tempered LC using 1743 bbls WF & YF = = 8011-14 8094-9 Stage 6 -Wasatch

ll8 gelw/ scalefrac inprepad = = 8100-03 8216-19 Stage 6 -Wasatch
= = 8398-401 Stage 6 -Wasatch

Stage 5:
3/17/2005 76,000# 20/40 Tempered LC using 1785 bbls WF = = 8523-27 8541-45 Stage 5 -Wasatch

& YF 118 ge w/ scalefrac in prepad = = 8602-06 Stage 5 -Wasatch
= = 8704-06 Stage 5 -Wasatch

Stage 4:
3/16/2005 72,250# 20/40 Tempered LC sand using 1813 bbls = = 8992-96 Stage 4 -Dark Canyon

WF & YF ll8 gel = = 9161-66 Stage 4 -Dark Canyon

Stage 1,2,3: = = 10014-19 10628-34 Stage 3 -Lower Mesaverde
Frac stimulate w/ ACFrac PR6000 & 35 PPG = = 10678-82 10724-27 Stage 3 -Lower Mesaverde
Hybor = = 10754-57 11236-39 Stage 3 -Lower Mesaverde

= = 11278-82 11383-86 Stage 3 -Lower Mesaverde
= = 11494-97 Stage 3 -Lower Mesaverde

CIBP @ = = 11610-2 Stage 2 -Lower Mesaverde
11,580 = = 11856-6 Stage 2 -Lower Mesaverde

= = 11930-3 Stage 2 -Lower Mesaverde

CIBP @ = = 12010-1 Stage 1 -Lower Mesaverde
11,975 = = 12054-6 Stage 1 -Lower Mesaverde

RevisedBy Date
KTM 7/17/2014 | M ) 12,517

RECEIVED: Aug. 04,

Sundry Number: 53820 API Well Number: 43047336530000

As of 6/13/2014
LEASE: UTU-76262 MELL #: Federal 31-29 #1
FIELD: Riverbend

LOCATION: 682' FNL & 2042' FEL
COUNTY: Uintah ST: Utah API: 43-047-33653

CONDUCTOR GL: 4,832'
SIZE: 13 3/8" I I KB: 4,848'
WT/GRD: H-40 SPUD DATE:
WT/GRD: 48# COMP DATE:
CSA: 222'
SX: 260 sx Class G
CIRC: Y I I
TOC: Surf CIBP @ 11,975' w/ 15' cement
HOLE SIZE: 17 1/2"

I I
SURFACE CASING

SIZE: 9 5/8" I I CIBP @11,580' w/ 1 sack cement
WT/GRD: K-55

WT/GRD: 36#
CSA: 3,571 I I
SX: 465 sx Hi-Fill Fish @11,280' consists of 130' of scaled tubing scaled in the

460 sx Class G hole
CIRC: Y
TOC: Surf
HOLE SIZE: 12 1/4"

Temporary CIBP @5,500' (5/28/2014)
PRODUCTION CASING

SIZE: 4 1/2"
WT/GRD: P-110

Tubing Detail: 173 jnts 2 3/8" EUE 8md 4.7#N-80 tbg + 4 ½"
WT/GRD: 13.5# TAC + 2 jnts 2 3/8" EUE 8md 4.7#N-80 tbg + PSN + 4'x2 3/8"

3058 s
6C45ass

G
EUE 8md J-55 perf sub + bullet nosed jnt 2 3/8" EUE 8md 4.7#

J-55 tbg. TAC @5,347', PSN @5,416', EOT @5,452'.

CIRC: Y (6/9/2014)

TOC: Surface
HOLE SIZE: 7 7/8"

Rod Detail: 1 ¼" x 22' polish rod + 1 @4' 7/8" pony rod + 1
@6' 7/8" pony rod + 71 @7/8" guided rods (4 guides per rod)

Stimulation + 135 @¾" guided rods (4 guides per rod) + 10 @1 ¼" K bars
+ 2"x1 ½"x16 RHAC pump. (6/13/2014)

Stage 9:
5/30/2014

Frac well w/ 50,000# 20/40 white sand, 17 bbls FR
slick water, 593 bbls 15# Delta-140 gelled/

crosslinked fluid, and flushed w/80 bbls 2% KCl
= = 5382-92 Stage 9 -Wasatch

Stage 8: CIBP @
3/18/2005 79464# 20/40 Tempered LC using 1205 YF x- 5,500

linked gel w/ scalefrac inprepad = = 6618-26 Stage 8 -Wasatch

Stage 7:
3/18/2005 74,648# 20/40 Tempered LC using l834 bbls WF = = 6896-900 6914-18 Stage 7 -Wasatch

& YF 118 gel = = 7020-24 Stage 7 -Wasatch
= = 7042-46 Stage 7 -Wasatch

Stage 6:
3/17/2005 74,000# Tempered LC using 1743 bbls WF & YF = = 8011-14 8094-9 Stage 6 -Wasatch

ll8 gelw/ scalefrac inprepad = = 8100-03 8216-19 Stage 6 -Wasatch
= = 8398-401 Stage 6 -Wasatch

Stage 5:
3/17/2005 76,000# 20/40 Tempered LC using 1785 bbls WF = = 8523-27 8541-45 Stage 5 -Wasatch

& YF 118 ge w/ scalefrac in prepad = = 8602-06 Stage 5 -Wasatch
= = 8704-06 Stage 5 -Wasatch

Stage 4:
3/16/2005 72,250# 20/40 Tempered LC sand using 1813 bbls = = 8992-96 Stage 4 -Dark Canyon

WF & YF ll8 gel = = 9161-66 Stage 4 -Dark Canyon

Stage 1,2,3: = = 10014-19 10628-34 Stage 3 -Lower Mesaverde
Frac stimulate w/ ACFrac PR6000 & 35 PPG = = 10678-82 10724-27 Stage 3 -Lower Mesaverde
Hybor = = 10754-57 11236-39 Stage 3 -Lower Mesaverde

= = 11278-82 11383-86 Stage 3 -Lower Mesaverde
= = 11494-97 Stage 3 -Lower Mesaverde

CIBP @ = = 11610-2 Stage 2 -Lower Mesaverde
11,580 = = 11856-6 Stage 2 -Lower Mesaverde

= = 11930-3 Stage 2 -Lower Mesaverde

CIBP @ = = 12010-1 Stage 1 -Lower Mesaverde
11,975 = = 12054-6 Stage 1 -Lower Mesaverde

RevisedBy Date
KTM 7/17/2014 | M ) 12,517

RECEIVED: Aug. 04,

Sundry Number: 53820 API Well Number: 43047336530000

As of 6/13/2014
LEASE: UTU-76262 MELL #: Federal 31-29 #1
FIELD: Riverbend

LOCATION: 682' FNL & 2042' FEL
COUNTY: Uintah ST: Utah API: 43-047-33653

CONDUCTOR GL: 4,832'
SIZE: 13 3/8" I I KB: 4,848'
WT/GRD: H-40 SPUD DATE:
WT/GRD: 48# COMP DATE:
CSA: 222'
SX: 260 sx Class G
CIRC: Y I I
TOC: Surf CIBP @ 11,975' w/ 15' cement
HOLE SIZE: 17 1/2"

I I
SURFACE CASING

SIZE: 9 5/8" I I CIBP @11,580' w/ 1 sack cement
WT/GRD: K-55

WT/GRD: 36#
CSA: 3,571 I I
SX: 465 sx Hi-Fill Fish @11,280' consists of 130' of scaled tubing scaled in the

460 sx Class G hole
CIRC: Y
TOC: Surf
HOLE SIZE: 12 1/4"

Temporary CIBP @5,500' (5/28/2014)
PRODUCTION CASING

SIZE: 4 1/2"
WT/GRD: P-110

Tubing Detail: 173 jnts 2 3/8" EUE 8md 4.7#N-80 tbg + 4 ½"
WT/GRD: 13.5# TAC + 2 jnts 2 3/8" EUE 8md 4.7#N-80 tbg + PSN + 4'x2 3/8"

3058 s
6C45ass

G
EUE 8md J-55 perf sub + bullet nosed jnt 2 3/8" EUE 8md 4.7#

J-55 tbg. TAC @5,347', PSN @5,416', EOT @5,452'.

CIRC: Y (6/9/2014)

TOC: Surface
HOLE SIZE: 7 7/8"

Rod Detail: 1 ¼" x 22' polish rod + 1 @4' 7/8" pony rod + 1
@6' 7/8" pony rod + 71 @7/8" guided rods (4 guides per rod)

Stimulation + 135 @¾" guided rods (4 guides per rod) + 10 @1 ¼" K bars
+ 2"x1 ½"x16 RHAC pump. (6/13/2014)

Stage 9:
5/30/2014

Frac well w/ 50,000# 20/40 white sand, 17 bbls FR
slick water, 593 bbls 15# Delta-140 gelled/

crosslinked fluid, and flushed w/80 bbls 2% KCl
= = 5382-92 Stage 9 -Wasatch

Stage 8: CIBP @
3/18/2005 79464# 20/40 Tempered LC using 1205 YF x- 5,500

linked gel w/ scalefrac inprepad = = 6618-26 Stage 8 -Wasatch

Stage 7:
3/18/2005 74,648# 20/40 Tempered LC using l834 bbls WF = = 6896-900 6914-18 Stage 7 -Wasatch

& YF 118 gel = = 7020-24 Stage 7 -Wasatch
= = 7042-46 Stage 7 -Wasatch

Stage 6:
3/17/2005 74,000# Tempered LC using 1743 bbls WF & YF = = 8011-14 8094-9 Stage 6 -Wasatch

ll8 gelw/ scalefrac inprepad = = 8100-03 8216-19 Stage 6 -Wasatch
= = 8398-401 Stage 6 -Wasatch

Stage 5:
3/17/2005 76,000# 20/40 Tempered LC using 1785 bbls WF = = 8523-27 8541-45 Stage 5 -Wasatch

& YF 118 ge w/ scalefrac in prepad = = 8602-06 Stage 5 -Wasatch
= = 8704-06 Stage 5 -Wasatch

Stage 4:
3/16/2005 72,250# 20/40 Tempered LC sand using 1813 bbls = = 8992-96 Stage 4 -Dark Canyon

WF & YF ll8 gel = = 9161-66 Stage 4 -Dark Canyon

Stage 1,2,3: = = 10014-19 10628-34 Stage 3 -Lower Mesaverde
Frac stimulate w/ ACFrac PR6000 & 35 PPG = = 10678-82 10724-27 Stage 3 -Lower Mesaverde
Hybor = = 10754-57 11236-39 Stage 3 -Lower Mesaverde

= = 11278-82 11383-86 Stage 3 -Lower Mesaverde
= = 11494-97 Stage 3 -Lower Mesaverde

CIBP @ = = 11610-2 Stage 2 -Lower Mesaverde
11,580 = = 11856-6 Stage 2 -Lower Mesaverde

= = 11930-3 Stage 2 -Lower Mesaverde

CIBP @ = = 12010-1 Stage 1 -Lower Mesaverde
11,975 = = 12054-6 Stage 1 -Lower Mesaverde

RevisedBy Date
KTM 7/17/2014 | M ) 12,517

RECEIVED: Aug. 04,



RECEIVED: Sep. 02, 2014

                           FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-76262 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 FEDERAL 31-29 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 996-1805  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 PARIETTE BENCH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0682 FNL 2042 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

9 /22 /2014

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  Temporary shut in

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Gasco intends to temporarily shut in the Federal 31-29 in order to drill
seven additional wells from the existing well pad. Gasco plans on

setting a retrievable bridge plug at 4950', pulling all tubing out of the
well, filling the hole with 2% KCL water, removing the well head, and

capping the well with a metal plate. The Federal 31-29 will remain shut
in for the duration of drilling and completion on the seven wells,

approximately 180 days.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Jessica Berg 303 996-1805

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 9 /2 /2014

September 17, 2014

Sundry Number: 55063 API Well Number: 43047336530000Sundry Number: 55063 API Well Number: 43047336530000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-76262

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 31-29

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 996-1805 Ext PARIETTE BENCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0682 FNL 2042 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

9/22/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Temporary shut in

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco intends to temporarily shut in the Federal 31-29 in order to drill Accepted by the
seven additional wells from the existing well pad. Gasco plans on utah Division of

setting a retrievable bridge plug at 4950', pulling all tubing out of the oil, Gas and Mining

well, filling the hole with 2% KCL water, removing the well head, and Date:
September 17, 2014

capping the well with a metal plate. The Federal 31-29 will remain shut
in for the duration of drilling and completion on the seven wells, sy: \ J \ È

approximately 180 days.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 9/2/2014

RECEIVED: Sep. 02,

Sundry Number: 55063 API Well Number: 43047336530000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-76262

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 31-29

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047336530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 996-1805 Ext PARIETTE BENCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0682 FNL 2042 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNE Section: 29 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

9/22/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Temporary shut in

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco intends to temporarily shut in the Federal 31-29 in order to drill Accepted by the
seven additional wells from the existing well pad. Gasco plans on utah Division of

setting a retrievable bridge plug at 4950', pulling all tubing out of the oil, Gas and Mining

well, filling the hole with 2% KCL water, removing the well head, and Date:
September 17, 2014

capping the well with a metal plate. The Federal 31-29 will remain shut
in for the duration of drilling and completion on the seven wells, sy: \ J \ È

approximately 180 days.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 9/2/2014

RECEIVED: Sep. 02,



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining 

Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only 

Effective Date· 4/16/2015 
FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERA TOR: 
Gasco Prodcution Company N2575 Badlands Production Company N4265 
7979 E. Tufts A venue, Suite 11500 7979 E. Tufts A venue, Suite 11500 
Denver, CO 80237 Denver, CO 80237 
303-996-1805 303-996-1805 

CA Number(s): Unit(s):Gate Canyon, Wilkin Ridge Deep, RBU-EOR-GRRV 

WELL INFORMATION: 
Well Name API 
See Attached List 

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION: 
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2015 
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2015 
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 1454161-0143 

REVIEW: 
1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: 
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/3/2015 
4. OPS/SIITA welles) reviewed for full cost bonding: 1120/2016 
5. VIC5 on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: N/A 
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: None 
7. Inspections ofPA statelfee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): 

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION: 
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 

2. Indian welles) covered by Bond Number: 
3.State/fee welles) covered by Bond Number(s): 

DATA ENTRY: 

1. Welles) update in the OGIS on: 

2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on: 

3. Unites) operator number update in OGIS on: 
4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on: 
5. StatelFee welles) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on: 

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION: 

SUR0027842 
N/A 
SUR0027845 
SUR0035619 -FCB 

1122/2016 
1122/2016 
1122/2016 
N/A 
1122/2016 
N/A 

N/A 
6/2/2015 

N/A 

1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division 
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 1122/2016 
COMMENTS: 

1/22/2016 

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 4/16/2015
FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERATOR:
Gasco Prodcution Company N2575 Badlands Production Company N4265
7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500 7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500
Denver, CO 80237 Denver, CO 80237
303-996-1805 303-996-1805

CA Number(s): Unit(s):Gate Canyon, Wilkin Ridge Deep, RBU-EOR-GRRV

WELL INFORMATION:
Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status
See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION:
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2015
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2015
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 1454161-0143

REVIEW:
1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 6/2/2015
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: N/A
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/3/2015
4. OPS/SI/TA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 1/20/2016
5. UIC5 on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: N/A
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: None
7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): N/A

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: SUROO27842
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A
3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): SUROO27845

SUROO35619-FCB

DATA ENTRY:
1. Well(s) update in the OGIS on: 1/22/2016
2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on: 1/22/2016
3. Unit(s) operator number update in OGIS on: 1/22/2016
4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on: N/A
5. State/Fee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 1/22/2016
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 1/22/2016
COMMENTS:



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

Well Name -
FEDERAL 23-18G-9-19 
FEDERAL 14-17G-9-19 

-------
FEDERAL 13-18G-9-19 
FEDERAL 23-29G-9-19 
FEDERAL 24-20G-9-19 
FEDERAL 31-21 G-9-19 
Federal 323-29-9-19 
Federal 421-29-9-19 
Federal 322-29-9-1 9 
Federal 43 1 -29-9-1 9 
Federal 432-29-9-1 9 
Federal 414-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 412-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 

.. _--

-----_._- -
federal 321-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 321-29-9-19 
Federal 212-29-9-19 
State 321-32-9-19 
State 423-32-9-19 
State 421-32-9-19 
State 413-32-9-1 9 
State 323-32-9-1 9 
State 431-32-9-19 ---
Desert Spring State 224-36-9-18 
Desert Spring State 243-36-9-18 
Desert Spring State 241-36-9-18 
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 

-
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-11-17 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-1 0-1 7 
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 
GATE CYN ST 23-16-1 1-16 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 

-----
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 
SQUA W CROSSING U 5 
RBU 5-lID -
FEDERAL 7-25A 

Section 
18 
17 
18 
29 
20 
21 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
32 
32 
32 
32 
32 
32 
36 
36 
36 
30 
29 
23 
26 
19 
17 
21 
32 
20 
17 
19 
32 
4 
32 
29 
16 
16 
29 
8 
16 
20 
20 
4 
22 
24 
2 
11 

------

25 

TWN 'RNG API Number Enti!Y 
090S 190E 4304752496 
090S 190E 4304752522 
090S 190E 4304752538 ' 
090S 190E 4304752544 

. '.' 

090S 190E 4304752545 
090S 190E 4304752546 
090S 190E 4304753026 
090S 190E 4304753027 
090S 190E 4304753029 ; 
090S 190E 4304753030 
090S 190E 4304753031 i 
090S 190E 4304753070 
090S 190E 4304753073 
090S 190E 4304753076 
090S 190E 4304753078 
090S 190E 4304753079 , 
090S 190E 4304753080 
090S 190E 4304753133 1 
090S 190E 4304754479 
090S 190E 4304754480 
090S 190E 4304754481 
090S 190E 4304754482 ! 

090S 190E 4304754483 
090S 190E 4304754529 
090S 180E 4304754541 
090S 180E 4304754542 
090S 180E 4304754543 
090S 190E 4304753012 19650 
100S 170E 4301333098 15941 
090S 190E 4304736915 16556 
090S 180E 4304738573 17201 
090S 190E 4304739777 18344 
O9OS 190E 4304739800 17202 
1I0S 150E 4301332391 13787 
100S 170E 4301332447 14033 
1l0S 150E 4301332475 14417 
100S 170E 4301332560 -14726 
1l0S 160E 4301332611 14439 
100S ,170E 4301332619 15649 
11 OS 170E 4301332674 15537 

' 100S 170E 4301332676 15242 
100S 170E 4301332679 14033 
1I0S 150E 4301332685 16082 
100S 170E 4301332730 15243 
100S 170E 4301332773 15370 
1I0S 170E 4301332778 14802 
1I0S 160E 4301332888 15098 
100S 170E 4301333081 15714 
100S 1 70E '4301333087 i 15807 
11 OS 170E 4301333099 ' 15920 
1I0S 140E 4301333437 16919 
1I0S ,140E 4301333443 16367 
100S 180E 4304730129 16266 
100S ! 180E 4304730409 9005 

I 

090S 180E I4304730624 19030 

Mineral Surface Type Status 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal 'GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 

---
Federal Federal GW APD 
'Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
Federal Federal GW DRL 

--

Federal Federal GW OPS 
Fee Fee GW OPS 
Federal Federal GW OPS 
Federal Federal GW OPS 
Federal Federal ,GW OPS 
State State GW P 
State State GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
State State GW P ---
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Eederal GW P 

.. -

Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State 'OW P 
Federal Federal OW P --
Federal Federal OW P 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

WellName Section TWN RNGAPINumber Entity Mineral Surface TypeiStatus
FEDERAL 23-18G-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304752496 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 14-17G-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304752522 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 13-18G-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304752538 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 23-29G-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304752544 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 24-20G-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304752545 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 31-21G-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304752546 Federal Federal OW APD
Federal 323-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753026 Federal_ Federal GW APD
Federa1421-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753027 Federal Federal GW APD
Federal 322-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753029 Federal Federal GW APD
Federa1431-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753030 Federal Federal GW APD
Federal 432-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753031 Federal Federal GW APD
Federa1414-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753070 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 412-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753073 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753076 Federal Federal GW APD
federal 321-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753078 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753079 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 321-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753080 Federal Federal GW APD
Federal 212-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753133 Federal Federal GW APD
State 321-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754479 State State GW APD
State 423-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754480 State State GW APD
State 421-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754481 State State GW APD
State 413-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754482 State State GW APD

te 323-32-9-19 32 0908 190E 4304754483 State State GW APD
State 431-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754529 State State GW APD
Desert Spring State 224-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304754541 State State GW APD
Desert Spring State 243-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304754542 State State GW APD
Desert Spring State 241-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304754543 State State GW APD
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753012 19650 Federal Federal GW DRL
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301333098 15941 Federal Federal GW OPS
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 090S 190E 4304736915 16556 Fee Fee GW OPS
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738573 17201 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304739777 18344 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304739800 17202 Federal Federal GW OPS
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 1108 150E 4301332391 13787 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332447 14033 State State GW P
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 110S 150E 4301332475 14417 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 100S 170E 4301332560 14726 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 110S 160E 4301332611 14439 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332619 15649 State_ State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-l l-17 4 110S 170E 4301332674 15537 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332676 15242 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332679 14033 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-ll-15 16 110S 150E 4301332685 16082 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 100S 170E 4301332730 15243 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332773 15370 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 8 l10S 170E 4301332778 14802 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 110S 160E 4301332888 15098 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333081 15714 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333087 15807 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 1108 170E 4301333099 15920 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 l10S 140E 4301333437 16919 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 24 110S 140E 4301333443 16367 Federal Federal GW P
SQUAW CROSSING U 5 2 100S 180E 4304730129 16266 State State OW P
RBU 5-11D 11 l00S 180E 4304730409 9005 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 090S 180E 4304730624 9030 Federal Federal OW



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

RBU6-2D 
NGC 33-18J 
RBU 13-2D 

2 
18 
2 

-.-------~--~~----~~--

RBU 16-3D 3 
-----

RBU 1O-1lD 11 
RBU 8-10D 10 
RBU 15-3D 3 
RBU 12-12D 12 
RBU2-10D 10 
RBU 3-15D 15 
RBU 3-12D 12 

--

STATE 7-36A 36 
FEDERAL 34-29 29 
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 
FED 24-20-9-19 20 
FED 44-20-9-19 20 
FED 23-21-9-19 21 
FED 32-31-9-19 31 
FED 42-29-9-19 29 
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 
STATE4-32B 32 
FED 14-18-2 #1 18 
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 
L YTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 

--

FED 11-21-9-19 21 
FED 22-30-10-18 30 

- -

FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 
FED 11-22-9-19 22 
FED 42-21-9-19 21 
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 

----
FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 

-~ ~--

DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 

--
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 

- --_._--

DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 

-
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 

100S 180EI4304731190 7075 State State OW P 
090S 190E:4304731200 16155 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180Ei4304731280 16267 State State OW P 

----

100S 180E 14304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 1180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal OW P 

-+-- ---- c----
100S 1180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal OW P 
100S ~~304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180EI4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180E 14304731801 110784 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180E 4304733600 13213 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180E 4304733739 14492 Federal Federal OW IP 
090S 180E 4304733741 14244 State State GW P 
090S 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 180E 14304733983 13182 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E !4304734111 13441 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 1190E 4304734169 14140 'Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E !4304734201 13641 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 14304734202 113455 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 170E 4304734286 13492 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 1190E 4304734314 14440 State State GW P 
100S 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 170EI4304734551 13726 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 14304734607 :13640 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E:4304734608 14151 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 180E 4304734924 14280 Federal Federal GW P 

-~ 

090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735405 114928 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal GW IP 
090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 14304735614 14442 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E!4304735623 i 14640 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735732 14496 Fee Fee GW P 
090S 190E4304735733 14519 Fee Fee GW P 
100S 180E'4304735808 !15592 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 190E 4304735844 114356 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 180E 4304735845 14639 State State GW P 
090S 190E 4304735995 14871 State State GW P 
090S 190E 14304736093 i 14976 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal GW P ---f----

090S 180E 4304736219 14738 State State GW P 
090S 180E!4304736220 14763 State State GW P 
090S 180E 4304736233 14764 State State GW P +---
090S 180E 4304736241 14992 State State GW P 
090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State GW P 
090S 190E '4304736271 115884 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal GW P 

---
090S 190E !4304736442 .15715 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 180E ;4304736600 ! 14977 Federal Federal GW P 
090S I 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal GW ,P 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU6i-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731190 7075 State State ONV P
14GiC33-18J 18 090S 190E ‡304731200 6155 Federal Federal DNV P
FU3U13-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731280 16267 State State CA¥ P
RBU 16-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P
FU3tJ 10-111) 11 100S 180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal ()VV P
FU3t] 8-10L) 10 100S 180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal ()?V JP
RBU 15-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 12-12D 12 100S 180E 4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P
RBU2-10D 10 100S 180E 4304731801 10784 Federed Federed Cygr p
IUBU3-15D 15 100S 180E 4304733600 13213 Federed Federed CA¥ P
FU3U3-12D 12 100S 180E 4304733739 14492 Federed Federal OMT P
STATE7-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733741 14244 Sutte Smte GMT P
FEDERAL 34-29 29 090S 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 100S 180E 4304733983 13182 Federal Federal GW P
FEDEFLAL23-29#l 29 090S 190E 4304734111 13441 Federal Federal GNV P
FED 24-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal GW P
FE]D44-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734169 14140 Federal Federed (ITV P
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 13641 Federal Federal GW P
FEI342-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304734202 13455 Federal Federal GYV P
PETESM'ASH23-12#1 12 100S 170E 4304734286 13492 Federed Federal GNV P
STATE 4-32B 32 090S 190E 4304734314 14440 State State GW P
FEl3 14-18-2 #1 18 100S 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal GNV P
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 100S 170E 4304734551 13726 Federal Federal GW P
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304734607 13640 Federal Federal GW P
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 14151 Federal Federal GW P
FED22-30-10-18 30 100S 180E 4304734924 14280 Fedenal Federal GB¥ P
FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal GW P
FEI3 11-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal GVV P
FED 42-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735405 14928 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 090S 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal GW P
FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal GW P
FEDEFDAL 12-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304735614 14442 Fedenal Feden11 GMT P
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735623 14640 Federal Federal GW P
FEE)EFLAL41-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Feden11 (39V P
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735732 14496 Fee Fee GW P
LikNIB TItUST24-14-9-19 14 090S 190E 4304735733 14519 Fee Fee GMT P
FEEIEftAL 11-22-10-18 22 100S 180E =‡304735808 15592 Federal Federal (39V P
FEDERAL21-6-10-19 6 100S 190E 4304735844 14356 Federed Federed GNV P
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304735845 14639 State State GW P
STitTE 12-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304735995 14871 State State GVV P
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736093 14976 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736219 14738 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736220 14763 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736233 14764 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736241 14992 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736271 15884 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal GW P
FEEIEftAL23-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 43047369‡42 15715 Federal Federal (svV P
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736600 14977 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal GW



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 
-----

FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 
~HEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 -----_ .. _. __ ._--

FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 

--

----------.. -------

----_. __ . __ ._----_._._._._ .... -

FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 
----------

LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 

125 090S 180E i4304736727 '15475 Federal Federal 
--

30 090S 190E'4304736739 !15476 Federal Federal 
-------
25 090S 180E'4304736740 15213 Federal Federal 
19 090S 190E 14304736771 

-----

15355 Federal Federal 
-- , -

~L ____ f?90S :180EI4304736772 15338 Federal Federal 
f-----'---+---

30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal 
--

22 090S 190E 14304736913 15187 Fee Fee 
- -- ------- - -- ----f-------

LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 090S 190E:4304736916 : 17012 Fee Fee --_._----

DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S 180Ei4304737115 115011 State State 
.... __ .. _._---_.--- -_ .. --------

FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 '090S .190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal 

.--------- -- 1--

UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 14304737132 15087 i State State 
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E i4304737338 ! 15365 State State 
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S 190E :4304737611 116311 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S i 190E!4304737612 16051 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S 119OE[4304737613 16052 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S '190E:4304737621 16253 !Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S 190E I4304737622 16264 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S 190E :4304737630 16557 Federal Federal 
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S 180E

'
4304737631 15961 Federal Federal 

~ 

FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S 1180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal 
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S : 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal 
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S 180E !430473767616254 iState State 

----

180E4304737677h5806 State UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 100S State 
---- c---

UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S ,180E'4304738028 16868 State State 
-- 1-----

FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S ',190E 4304738336 116467 Federal Federal 
1-------

190E 4304738337 116119 IFederal Federal FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 090S --------------f-----

SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S 180E4304738351 16884 Federal Federal 
--- -

180E~4304738352 ~~ WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S 16349 Federal Federal _.-----

SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S 180E [4304738353 16210 Federal Federal 
-

FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S : 190E 4304738407 ; 16236 Federal Federal 
--

SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 090S 180E!4304738465 16558 Federal Federal 
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S 180EI4304738469 16449 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal 
LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S ,190E 4304738673 : 15832 Fee Fee 
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 11 100S 180E4304738896 16792 Federal Federal 
STATE 21-32B 32 090S 190E:4304739170 16309 State State 
STATE 22-32A 32 090S : 190EI4304739171 16308 State State 
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 1 190E 4304739172 116310 State State 
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E!4304739717 17054 Federal Federal 
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E,4304739729 17241 Federal Federal -
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 ! 17266 Federal Federal 

. -------. 
4304739773 -: 17013 ,Federal DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 1 100S 180E Federal .... -.--_ ..... -

FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E4304740233 17014 Federal Federal 
- - - -

FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E:4304751280 18211 Federal Federal ---------------c------ c---
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190Ei4304751281 18210 Federal Federal 

----f----
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S : 190E 4304752870_1~64? IFederal Federal -------------------r--------- c----

~~~~~~ !;~:~~:~:! ~ 30 090S 190E14304752872 19648 Federal Federal --_ .. __ .. 
30 090S 190E ;4304753011 19649 Federal Federal 

- --1----------
180E 14304753324 '19783 Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S State State 

Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 : 180E 14304753325 36 090S 19783 State State 
--- --

Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S '180E 4304753326 19747 State State 
Desert SI>ring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S 180E '4304753327 119747 State State 

-- _ ... 

DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E :4304753328 119783 State State 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S i 170E 4301332677 ! 15144 State State 
RBU 4-11D III 100S 180E :4304730718 16269 Federal Federal 

GW P 
--

GW P 
-~-. 

GW P 
GW P 
GW IP 
GW P 
GW P 
----c------
GW P 

--
GW P 
GW P 
GW ,p 

GW IP 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW Ip 

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW ,p 

--

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 

-------

GW ip 

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW ,P 

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW iP 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW Ip 

GW P 
-----

GW P 
GW P 

----

GW P 
---

OW P 
OW P 
GW P 

--
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 

- --
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW :S 
OW S 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736727 15475 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736739 15476 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736740 15213 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736771 15355 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736772 15338 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304736913 15187 Fee Fee GW P
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 090S 190E 4304736916 17012 Fee Fee GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304737115 15011 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737132 15087 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737338 15365 State State GW P
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737611 16311 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737612 16051 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737613 16052 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737621 16253 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737622 16264 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737630 16557 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737631 15961 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737676 16254 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737677 15806 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304738028 16868 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738336 16467 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738337 16119 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738351 16884 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738352 16349 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738353 16210 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738407 16236 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738465 16558 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738469 16449 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304738673 15832 Fee Fee GW P
UTELAND FED 42-l l-10-18 11 100S 180E 4304738896 16792 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 21-32B 32 090S 190E 4304739170 16309 State State GW P
STATE 22-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739171 16308 State State GW P
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739172 16310 State State GW P
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304739717 17054 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739729 17241 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 17266 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304739773 17013 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E 4304740233 17014 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304751280 18211 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304751281 18210 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752870 19647 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752872 19648 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753011 19649 Federal Federal GW P
Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753324 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753325 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753326 19747 State State GW P
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753327 19747 State State_ GW P
DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753328 19783 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332677 15144 State State GW S
RBU4-llD ll 100S 180E 4304730718 16269 Federal Federal OW



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

RBU2-llD 
~---- --
RBU 6-llD 
STATE2-32B c--
STATE 9-36A 
FEDERAL 13-30B 
STATE 13-36A 
FEDERAL 16-26A 

II ._-- -------

II 
32 

1

36 
30 

-----~---

36 
126 

------------------+-----

FEDERAL 31-29 129 
RBU I-IOD :10 ----------------------_.- I 

FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 i 18 

100S 180E 4304730826 116270 Federal Federal OW S 
------- ------ 1-------

100S 180E4304731192 16271 .Federal Federal OW S -+---- --
090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S 

-090S1180E 4304732225 il1364 
---

State State IGW S 
090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S 
090S il80E 4304733598 17838 State State IGW S 
090S 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S 
090S ! 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S 
100S 1180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW .S 
090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal iGW S 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU 2-l lD 11 100S 180E 4304730826 16270 Federal Federal OW S
RBU 6-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731192 16271 Federal Federal OW S
STATE 2-32B 32 '090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S
STATE 9-36A 36 _ _090S 180E 4304732225 11364 State State GW S
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S
STATE 13-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733598 17838 State State GW S
FEDERAL 16-26A 26 090S 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S
RBU 1-10D 10 100S 180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW S
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal GW



FORM 9 STATE OF UTAH 
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER: 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significanUy deepen existing wells below current boItom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to 
drlH horizontal laterals. Use APPLlCA TION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for sUCh proposals. 

1. TYPE OF WELL 
OILWELL 0 GAS WELL IlJ OTHER __________ _ 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 

Gasco Production Company 
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: 

7979 E. Tufts Ave. 

4. LOCATIONOFWELL 

CITY Denver 

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 0633 FNL 1512 FWL 

STATE CO zIP80237 

QTRIOTR, SECTION, TOWJIISHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 1 10S 18E S 

I PHONE NUMBER: 

(303) 483-0044 

UTU-76482 
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTIEE OR TRIBE NAME: 

7. UMT or CA AGREEMENT NAME: 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER: 

Desert Spring Fed 21-1-10-18 
9. API NUMBER: 

4304737631 
10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT: 

Uteland Butte 

COUNTY: Uintah 

STATE: 
UTAH 

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION 

rlI 0 ACIDIZE 0 DEEPEN 0 REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION 
NOTICE OF INTENT 

(SubmH in Duplicate) 0 ALTER CASING 0 FRACTURE TREAT 0 SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL 

Approximate date work wil start: 0 CASING REPAIR 0 NEW CONSTRUCTION 0 TEMPORARILY ABANDON 

4/16/2015 0 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS III OPERATOR CHANGE 0 TUBING REPAIR 

0 CHANGE TUBING 0 PLUG AND ABANDON 0 VENT OR FLARE 

0 SUBSEQUENT REPORT 0 CHANGE WELL NAME 0 PLUG BACK 0 WATER DISPOSAL 
(Submit Original Form Only) 

0 CHANGE WELL STATUS 0 PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) 0 WATER SHUT-OFF 
Date of work completion: 

0 COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS 0 RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE 0 OTHER: 

0 CONVERT WELL TYPE 0 RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc. 

Gasco Production Company requests a change of operator 01:1 this well, in addition to the wells on the attached list from Gasco 
Production Company to Badlands Production Company, effective date of 4/1612015. 

Gasco Production Company 
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite 11 
Denver CO 80237 
303-996-1805 

Badlands Production Company 
7979 E Tufts Ave, Sui ~ 15 
Denver CO 80237 
303-996-1805 

(512000) 

TITLE 

DATE 

(See Instructions on Reverse Side) 

RECEIVED 
JUN 0 2 2015 

DIV OF OIL, GAS & MINING 

Engineering Tech 

511812015 

APPROVE 
JAN 22 2016 

~.oIL_ GAS & MINING ... 

BY:~Ch.Jt9 rn~cLU'\~ 

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-76482

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use thisform for proposals to drill newwells,significantlydeepen exislingwellsbelow currentbottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TODRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL O GASWELL OTHER Desert Spring Fed 21-1-10-18
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Gasco Production Company 4304737631
3 ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

7979 E. Tufts Ave CITY
Denver STATE CO ZIP 80237 (303) 483-0044 Uteland Butte

4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 0633 FNL 1512 FWL COUNTY: Uintah

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP. RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 1 10S 18E S STATE:
UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE O DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submitin Duplicate) ALTER CASING O FR^CTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TOREPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstad CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION O TEMPORARILYABANDON

4/16/2015 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE O TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING O PLUGAND ABANDON O VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME O PLUGBACK O WATER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOriginalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) O WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE O OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE O RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearly show allpertinentdetails including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco Production Company requests a change of operator on thiswell, in additionto thewells on the attached list from Gasco
Production Company to Badlands Production Company, effectivedate of 4/16/2015.

Gasco Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite 1
Denver CO 80237
303-996-1805

Michael Decker, Exec. Vi President & COO !)EC61VEL
Badlands Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Sui 15 JUN0 2 205
Denver CO 80237
303-996-1805

DIVOFOiL,GAS&MINING
Michael Decker, Exec. Vic PreWent&COO

NAME (PLEASE PRIN Lindsey Cooke TITLE Engineering Tech

SIGNATURE DATE 5/18/2015

(Thisspacefo Stateuseonly) APPROVED
JAN2 2 2016

(5/2000) (seeinstruolinsonReverseSide) IV.OlL GAS &



Well Name Section TWN RNO API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status 
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753012 19650 Federal Federal OW DRL 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 lOOS 170E 4301333098 15941 Federal Federal OW OPS 
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 O9OS 190E 4304736915 16556 Fee Fee OW OPS 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S lSOE 4304738573 17201 Federal Federal OW OPS 
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304739777 18344 Federal Federal OW OPS 
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304739800 17202 Federal Federal OW OPS 
OATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 II OS 150E 4301332391 13787 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 lOOS 170E 4301332447 14033 State State OW P 
OATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 II OS 150E 4301332475 14417 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 lOOS 170E 4301332560 14726 Federal Federal OW P 
OATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 II OS 160E 4301332611 14439 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 lOOS 170E 4301332619 15649 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-11-17 4 llOS 170E 4301332674 15537 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 lOOS 170E 4301332676 15242 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 lOOS l70E 4301332679 14033 Federal Federal OW P 
OATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 16 llOS 150E 4301332685 16082 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 lOOS 170E 4301332730 15243 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 lOOS 170E 4301332773 15370 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 8 llOS l70E 4301332778 14802 Federal Federal OW P 
OATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 llOS 160E 4301332888 15098 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 lOOS 170E 4301333081 15714 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 lOOS 170E 4301333087 15S07 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 II OS 170E 4301333099 15920 Federal Federal OW P 
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 II OS 140E 4301333437 16919 Federal Federal OW P 
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 24 II OS 140E 4301333443 16367 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 5-IID II lOOS 180E 4304730409 9005 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 O9OS 180E 4304730624 9030 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU6-2D 2 lOOS 180E 430473ll9O 7075 State State OW P 
NOC33-18J 18 O9OS 190E 4304731200 6155 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 13-20 2 lOOS 180E 4304731280 16267 State State OW P 
RBU 16-30 3 lOOS 180E 4304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU IO-IID II lOOS 180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU8-IOD 10 l00s 180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 15-30 3 lOOS 180E 4304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 12-120 12 lOOS lSOE 4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU2-IOD 10 lOOS 180E 4304731801 10784 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU3-15D 15 lOOS 180E 4304733600 13213 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU3-12D 12 lOOS 180E 4304733739 14492 Federal Federal OW P 
STATE7-36A 36 O9OS 180E 4304733741 14244 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 34-29 29 090S 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 lOOS 180E 4304733983 13182 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 090S 190E 4304734ll1 13441 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 24-20-9-19 20 O9OS 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 44-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734169 14140 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 13641 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 42-29-9-19 29 O9OS 190E 4304734202 13455 Federal Federal OW P 
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 lOOS 170E 4304734286 13492 Federal Federal OW P 
STATE4-32B 32 O9OS 190E 4304734314 14440 State State OW P 
FED 14-18-2 #1 18 lOOS 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 lOOS l70E 4304734551 13726 Federal Federal OW P 
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 O9OS 190E 4304734607 13640 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 14151 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 22-30-10-18 30 lOOS lSOE 4304734924 14280 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 11-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 42-21-9-19 21 O9OS 190E 4304735405 14928 Federal Federal OW P 
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 090S 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal OW P 

Well Name Section TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753012 19650 Federal Federal GW DRL
WILKINRIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 1005 170E 4301333098 15941 Federal Federal GW OPS
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 0905 190E 4304736915 16556 Fee Fee GW OPS
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738573 17201 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 090S 1908 4304739777 18344 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304739800 17202 Federal Federal GW OPS
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 110S 150E 4301332391 13787 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332447 14033 State State GW P
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 110S 150E 4301332475 14417 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 100S 170E 4301332560 14726 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 110S 160E 4301332611 14439 Federal Federal GW P
WILKINRIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332619 15649 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED l2-4-11-17 4 1108 170E 4301332674 15537 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332676 15242 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332679 14033 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 16 110S 150E 4301332685 16082 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 100S 170E 4301332730 15243 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332773 15370 Federal Federal GW P
WILKINRIDGE 32-08 8 110S 170E 4301332778 14802 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 110S 160E 4301332888 15098 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333081 15714 Federal Federal GW P
WILKINRIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333087 15807 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 110S 170E 4301333099 15920 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 110S 140E 4301333437 16919 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 24 110S 140E 4301333443 16367 Federal Federal GW P
RBU5-llD 11 100S 180E 4304730409 9005 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 090S 180E 4304730624 9030 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 6-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731190 7075 State State OW P
NGC 33-18J 18 090S 190E 4304731200 6155 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 13-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731280 16267 State State OW P
RBU 16-3D 3 1005 180E 4304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 10-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 8-10D 10 1005 180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 15-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 12-12D 12 1005 180E 4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 2-l0D 10 100S 180E 4304731801 10784 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 3-15D 15 100S 180E 4304733600 13213 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 3-12D 12 1005 180E 4304733739 14492 Federal Federal OW P
STATE 7-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733741 14244 State State GW P
FEDERAL 34-29 29 0905 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 100S 180E 4304733983 13182 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 090S 190E 4304734111 13441 Federal Federal GW P
FED 24-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal GW P
FED 44-20-9-19 20 0908 190E 4304734169 14140 Federal Federal GW P
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 13641 Federal Federal GW P
FED 42-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304734202 13455 Federal Federal GW P
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 100S 170E 4304734286 13492 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 4-32B 32 0908 190E 4304734314 14440 State State GW P
FED 14-18-2#1 18 100S 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal GW P
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 100S 170E 4304734551 13726 Federal Federal GW P
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304734607 13640 Federal Federal GW P
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 14151 Federal Federal GW P
FED 22-30-10-18 30 100S 180E 4304734924 14280 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal GW P
FED I 1-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal GW P
FED 42-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735405 14928 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 0905 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal GW



FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304735614 14442 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304735623 14640 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Federal OW P 
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 O9OS 190E 4304735732 14496 Fee Fee OW P 
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 090S 190E 4304735733 14519 Fee Fee OW P 
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 lOOS 180E 4304735808 15592 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 lOOS 190E 4304735844 14356 Federal Federal OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 41-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304735845 14639 State State OW P 
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 O9OS 190E 4304735995 14871 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736093 14976 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 O9OS 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 23-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736219 14738 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 21-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736220 14763 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 12-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736233 14764 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 43-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736241 14992 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304736271 15884 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736442 15715 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736600 14977 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304736727 15475 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736739 15476 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736740 15213 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736771 15355 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736772 15338 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal OW P 
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 O9OS 190E 4304736913 15187 Fee Fee OW P 
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 O9OS 190E 4304736916 17012 Fee Fee OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 33-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304737115 15011 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 O9OS 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal OW P 
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737132 15087 State State OW P 
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737338 15365 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304737611 16311 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304737612 16051 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304737613 16052 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304737621 16253 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 O9OS 190E 4304737622 16264 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304737630 16557 Federal Federal OW P 
DESERT SPRINO FED 21-1-10-18 I l00s 180E 4304737631 15961 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 I lOOS 180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal OW P 
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737676 16254 State State OW P 
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737677 15806 State State OW P 
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304738028 16868 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738336 16467 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304738337 16119 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 O9OS 180E 4304738351 16884 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304738352 16349 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304738353 16210 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738407 16236 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 O9OS 180E 4304738465 16558 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304738469 16449 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 O9OS 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal OW P 

FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 0908 190E 4304735614 14442 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735623 14640 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 0903 190E 4304735732 144% Fee Fee GW P
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 0908 190E 4304735733 14519 Fee Fee GW P
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 100S 180E 4304735808 15592 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 1005 190E 4304735844 14356 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304735845 14639 State State GW P
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304735995 14871 State State GW P
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736093 14976 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 0905 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736219 14738 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736220 14763 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736233 14764 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736241 14992 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736271 15884 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 0908 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 0908 190E 4304736442 15715 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736600 14977 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736727 15475 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736739 15476 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736740 15213 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736771 15355 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 0908 180E 4304736772 15338 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL41-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 0905 190E 4304736913 15187 Fee Fee GW P
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 0905 190E 4304736916 17012 Fee Fee GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304737115 15011 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 0905 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 0905 190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737132 15087 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737338 15365 State State GW P
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737611 16311 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737612 16051 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737613 16052 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737621 16253 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737622 16264 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737630 16557 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737631 15961 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737676 16254 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 1005 180E 4304737677 15806 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304738028 16868 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738336 16467 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 0905 190E 4304738337 16119 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738351 16884 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738352 16349 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738353 16210 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738407 16236 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 0905 180E 4304738465 16558 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738469 16449 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal GW



LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304738673 15832 Fee Fee GW P 
UTELAND FED 42-1 1-10-18 II 100S 180E 4304738896 16792 Federal Federal GW P 
STATE21-32B 32 090S 190E 4304739170 16309 State State GW P 
STATE 22-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739171 16308 Slale Stale GW P 
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739172 16310 Slale State GW P 
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304739717 17054 Federal Federal GW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739729 17241 Federal Federal GW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 17266 Federal Federal GW P 
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 100S 180E 4304739773 17013 Federal Federal GW P 
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E 4304740233 17014 Federal Federal GW P 
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304751280 18211 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304751281 18210 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752870 19647 Federal Federal GW P 
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752872 19648 Federal Federal GW P 
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753011 19649 Federal Federal GW P 
Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753324 19783 State Stale GW P 
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753325 19783 Slate Slale GW P 
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304753326 19747 State State GW P 
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304753327 19747 State State GW P 
DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753328 19783 Slale Stale GW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332677 15144 State State GW S 
SQUAW CROSSING U 5 2 100S 180E 4304730129 16266 Slale Slale OW S 
RBU 4-11D 11 100S 180E 4304730718 16269 Federal Federal OW S 
RBU2-11D II 100S 180E 4304730826 16270 Federal Federal OW S 
RBU6-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731192 16271 Federal Federal OW S 
STATE 2-32B 32 090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S 
STATE9-36A 36 090S 180E 4304732225 11364 Slale State GW S 
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S 
STATE 13-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733598 17838 State State GW S 
FEDERAL 16-26A 26 090S 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S 
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S 
RBU 1-100 10 100S 180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW S 
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal GW S 

LAMBTRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304738673 15832 Fee Fee GW P
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 11 1005 180E 4304738896 16792 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 21-32B 32 0905 190E 4304739170 16309 State State GW P
STATE 22-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739171 16308 State State GW P
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739172 16310 State State GW P
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 43047397\7 17054 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739729 17241 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED I 1-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 17266 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 I 100S 180E 4304739773 17013 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E 4304740233 17014 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304751280 18211 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304751281 18210 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752870 19647 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752872 19648 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL423-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753011 19649 Federal Federal GW P
Desert SpringsState 412-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753324 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753325 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753326 19747 State State GW P
DesertSpring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753327 19747 State State GW P
DESERT SPRINGS ST422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753328 19783 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332677 15144 State State GW S
SQUAW CROSSING US 2 1005 180E 4304730129 16266 State State OW S
RBU4-11D 11 100S 180E 4304730718 16269 Fedem! Fedeml ONV S
RBU2-IID 11 IDOS 180E 4304730826 16270 Fedeml Fedeml CAV S
RBU6-IID 11 IDOS 180E 4304731192 16271 Fedem! Fedeml OAV S
STATE2-32B 32 090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S
STATE9-36A 36 090S 180E 4304732225 11364 State State GW S
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S
STATE 13-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733598 17838 State State GW S
FEDERAL 16-26A 26 0905 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S
RBU 1-10D 10 100S 180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW S
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal GW
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