
For 3160--3 SUBMIT IN TluP TE* Form approved.
(November 1983) (Other instructions on Budget Bureau No. 1004-0136
(formerly 9-331C) UNITED STATES reverse side) Expires August 31, 1985

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND BERIAL NO.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT U-0807
APPLICATION FOR PERMITTO DRILL,DEEPEN,OR PLUG BACK O.IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEM RTRIBENAME

18. TYPE OF WORK

DRILLŒ DEEPENO PLUG BACK O 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPEOFWELL Wonsits Valley Federal
°w'.LLL 0

ELI. OTHER
NNELE MOUNLTH LE 8. FARM OR MM

i NAME OF OPERATOR WORSi ÌS Val ley
Chevron USA Inc. , Room 13097 9. WELL NO.

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR

P.O. Box 599, Denver, CO 80201 1Û. LD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

4. C&TI Nœor war,L (Report location clearly and in accordance with an firements-*) ODSitS/Green Ri Ver
653' FWL, 2313' FSL (NW, SW) p ii...c..r.,.....,oa.==.

AND SURVEY OR AREA

At proposed prod. zone AUGl a 1989653' FWL, 2313' FSL (NW, SW) Sec. 14-T8S-R21E
14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE* 12. COUNTY OR PARISH 13. STATE

ONO?±40 miles south of Vernal, UT Uintah Utah
10. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED* 16. NO. OF ACAmsi '17. NO, OF ACRES ASSIGNED

LOCATION TO NEAREST TO TKIS WELL
PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE, FT. AO A
(Also to nearest drlg. unit lizie, if any) ""

18. DISTANCE FROhi PROPOSED LOCATION* 19. PROPOSED PTH 2Û. ROTARY OR CABLE TOOLS
TO NEAREST WELL, DRILLING, COMPLETED,
OR APPLIED FOR, ON THIS LEASE, rr. 5700 Rotary

21. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 22. Arrnox. DATE WORK WILL START*

4855' GL (est) 4870' KB (est) 9-15-89
23. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

SIEE OF HOLE SIZE ÒF CASING WEIGHT PER FÒOT SETTING DEPTH QUANTITY OF CEMENT

12¼ 9-5/A" 36# ± 500 to surfare
8-3/4 7" 23 26# ±5700' to surface

It is proposed to drill this development well to a depth of 5700' to test the
Green River formation.

Attachments: Certified Plat
Drilling Program
Chevron Class III B0PE
Geologic Program
Multipoint Surface Use Plan

Completion Procedure to be submitted by Sundry Notice.

IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM : If proposal is to deepen or plug back, give data on present productive zone and proposed new productive
zone. If proposal is to drfH or deepen directionally, give pertinent data on subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths. Give blowout
preventer program, if any.

SIGNED TIKE Technical Assistant os,. 7-8-89

(Th pace for Federal or State ofBee use) APPROVED BY THE STATE
PER3IITNO APPROVAT.DAT, OF UTAH DMS! N OF

O GAS, AN MINING
APPROVED BY TITLE ATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY :

LL SPACIN : Ñ ,9

*SeeInstructionsOn ReverseSid
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of



TBS, R21E S.L.B. &M. CHEVRON U.S.A. INC.
WELL LOCATION, WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

, # 121, LOCATED AS SHOWN IN THES89°29'05"W
- 2658.70 S89°28'01"W

- 2640.06'
NW 1/4 SW 1/4 OF SECTION 14, T8S,
R21E, S.L.B.&M. UlNTAH COUNTY, UTAH.

BASIS OF ELEVATION

BENCH MARK #45EAM, LOCATED IN THE NORTH
1/2 OF SECTION 5, T85, R21E, S.L.B.&M. UINTAH
COUNTY, UTAH. ELEVATIONOF SAID BENCH MARK
IS 4688.72 FEET.

WONS/TS VALLEY
UN/T /121
Elev. Ungraded Ground = 4655'

o

14 N
653'

CERTlFI MX

THIS IS TO CERTlFY THAT THE
,

T*WS• OM
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUALSUR 410E BY ME OR
SUPER SION ANODTEDATTHE RE NTRUEAN THE

E ED SiSURVEY
GI TION NO. 5709

I AH

N89 21'07"E - 2668.54' N89°20'43"E
- 2673.10'

A = SECTION CORNERS USED. (aros. cop.) UnfrAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
P. O. BOX 1758 - 85 SOUTH - 200 RAST

NOTE: VERNAI, UTAH - 84078
BASIS OF BEARING IS THE EAST LINE SCALE DATE
OF THE NE 1/4 OF SECTION 13, T8S. 1" = 1000' 7-26--89
R21E, S.L.B.&M. WHICH IS ASSUMED PARTY REFERENCES
FROM G.L.O. fMFORMATIONTO BEAR D.A. R.D. T.D.H. G.L.O. PLATNO°49'W.

WEATNER FILE

CLEAR HOT CHEVRON U.S.A.
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DRILLING PROGRAM

Field Wonsits Valley Unit well WVFU#121 BepfDev Dev.
Est.

Location 660' FWL, 2180' FSL (NW, Sw) S14-T8S, R21E
Est

Drill X Deepen Elevations: GL 4855' KB ±4870'

ixxxtaxygi/Straight Hole: Proposed Measured TD 5500' Tvo 5500'
KOP N/A Build N/A Max. Angle N/A Avg. Angle N/A
Target Location N/A Bearing from surface N/A

1. Conductor Hole

Hole Size 26 Proposed Depth 80' casing size, weight & Grade 16"

2. Surface Hole

Hole Size 124" Proposed Depth 500' BOPE --------

Mud Program: Type MW FV WL Other
GEL-WTR 8.6 27 N/A

Potential Hazards: ÑOne
Electric Logging Program: None
Core/DST Program: None
Casing Program:

Size Grade . Weight Thread Section Length
9-5/8"__ K55 36#fft LTC 500'

Cement Program: Lead Slurry N/A
Tail Slurry Class "H" w/2% CaC/2 - 16.4 PPG

WOC Time 8 hrs. Casing Test 1500 psi Shoe test MWE -- ppg

3. Intermediate Hole

Hole Size Proposed Depth BOPE
Mud Program: Type MW FV WL Other

Potential Hazards:
Electric Logging Program:
Core/DST Program:
Casing Program:

Size Grade Weight Thread Section Length

CAmintProgram: Lead Slurry
Tail Slurry

WOC Time hrs. Casing Test psi Shoe test MWE
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Page 2
Drilling Program
Well WVFU121

4. Oil String/Liner Hole

Hole Size 8-3/4 Proposed Depth 5500' BOPE CUSAClass III 3M
Mud Program: Type MW FV WL Other

GEL-WTR ±8,6 -- --
500-25001

GEL-WTR-CHEM ±9.0 40 10-12 2500-TD
Potential Hazards: Loss circulation
Electric Logging Program: See attached geologic program
Core/DST Program: None
Casing Program:

Size Grade Weight Thread Section Length
7" K-55 23#/ft LTC SURF-4500

7" K-55 264/ff ITC 4500-TD

CeAentProgram: Lead Slurry Class 'H' w/16°/, GFI (tailored for depth A tamp )
Tail Slurry Class 'H' 16.4 PPG Tailored for depth & fomp

WOC Time 24 hrs. Casing Test 15pp psi Will attempt to bring cmt to
survace.

5. Auxiliary Equipment
Mud Logging Unit @ 20001 Rotating Head @
Geolograph @ Spyg Degasser @ _

Visulogger @ --- Desilter @ Sppp
Adj. Choke @ SQQi Centrifuge @ ...

PVT & Flowmeter @ SPgp Mud Cleaner @ ...

Trip Tank @ âgyp H2S Safety Equip. @
Other: Full opening drill pipe safety valve, inside RnP, apper A inwar Volly ency

valves 0 SPUD

6. Drill String Design
Surface Hole:

BHA 124" Bit,.8" DC, stab, 2,8" DC, XO, 6-3/4" DC's.
Drill Pipe 44" 16.6 #/ft grade E

Intermediate Hole:
BHA N/A
Drill Pipe N/A

Oil String/Liner Hole:
BRA 8-3/4" Bit, 2-6-3/4" DC's, stabl, 16 6-3/4" DC's.
Drill Pipe 4½" 16.6#/ft grade E,

7. Other
Inspect BHA after 2QQ rotating hours.
In "straight" holes run inclination surveys every 300-500 feet.
Gyro Surveys g/A
Check drilling breaks for flow below 1000 feet.
Fill drill pipe every 30 stds when running float.

8. General Remarks

Attached

9. Geologic Program

Attached

Prepared ByC.W. Boykin Date 7-10-89 Drilling Superintendent pp Date
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DRII.LING PROGRAM ATTACHMENT

GENERAL REMARKS

1. Applicable Federal and State Regulations will be adhered to during the
drilling of this well.

2. The drilling rig is to be level and the kelly centered over the hole before
drilling operations commence. Check periodically during the drilling of the
well to insure the rig stays level.

3. Prior to spud insure all toolpushers, drillers and crews are thoroughly
familiar with and understand the Chevron procedure for handling well kicks.

In H2S environments Chevron's contingency plan for your location is to be
read, understood and adhered to. All personnel are to be thoroughly familiar
with the use of air packs, the air supply system, locations of air packs and
what to do in the event of sour gas to surface.

4. Test BOPE before drilling out and every seven days thereafter. Perform low
pressure test (200 psi) and high pressure test. High pressure test should be
70% of BOPE working pressure or 70% of burst of last casing string, whichever
is less. Record BOP tests on Tour Reports. Notify applicable Federal and
State Regulatory Agencies 24 hours in advance of BOPE tests and record
notification and names on Tour Reports.

5. Do not reuse ring gaskets. Replace with new Rx or Bx ring gaskets.

6. Separate full opening safety valves and inside BOP's are required for each
size drill pipe in use. Test weekly with BOPE.

7. Run full open valve below kelly that can be run in the hole if necessary.
Do not use this valve as a mud saver sub.

8. BOP controls are to remain in the open position during drilling operations.

9. Hold pit drills for each crew at least once every seven days and record on
Tour Reports.

10. On trips fill the annulus before hydrostatic pressure drops 75 psi or every 5
stds of drill pipe, whichever is first. Use trip tanks to measure hole fill-
up and monitor at all times.

11. Use drill pipe floats at all times unless your supervisor instructs other-
wise.

12. Have wear ring installed in wellhead before tripping or rotating. Remember
to remove wear ring before running casing or when testing BOPE.
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13. Casing rams are to be installed and bonnets tested on last trip out before

running casing.

14. Run pilot and thickening time tests with rig mixing water for all cement

slurries prior to cementing operations.

15. Casing should be tested to 1,500 psi or 0.2 psi/ft., whichever is greater,

prior to drilling out and recorded on Tour Reports. Discuss the test

pressure with your supervisor and reference DM-49 before testing.

16. Drill out slick beneath each casing string. Drill deep enough to bury

stabilization to be picked up.

17. Do not drill with hardbanded pipe inside of casing.

18. Do not run full gauge stabilizers. Run stabilizers 1/16" to 1/8" undergauge.

19. When necessary to work pipe, keep pipe moving up and down. Rotating alone is

not considered sufficient.

20. Install and test full lubricator on all logging runs unless instructed

otherwise by supervisor.

21. Fully describe damaged or lost equipment on Tour Reports.



ATTACHMENT "B"
CHEVRON DRI G REFERENCESERIES
VOLUMEELEVEN
WELL CONTROL AND BLOWOUT PREVENTION

D. TYPE "B" KILL LINE -- CLASS 111,IV , AND V WELLS p
The type 8 kill line described below in Figure 11J.11 is the minimum recommended hookup for
installation on allClass Ill, Class IVand Class Vwells. Specificdesign features of thetype B killline
include:

1. The preferred killline connection to thewellis at thedrilling spool, however, a preventerside outlet
may be used when space restrictions exclude theuse ofa drillingspool. In allcases, the killline must
be installed below the uppermost blind rams so thewellcan be pumped intowith no pipe in the hole.

2 The arrangement includes two - 2" (nominal) gate valves installed at the drillingspool and an
upstream fluid cross. The outside valve may be hydraulicallyremote controlled.

3. Two pump-in lines should be attached to the fluid cross. The primary k111Ilne should be routed
to the rig standpipe where it can be manifolded to the rig pumps. The remote kill IIne shouldbe run
to a safe location awayfrom the rig or to the rigcementing unit. The remote killline shouldhave a
loose end connectionfor rigging-up a high pressure pumping unit.

4. Both the primary kill line and the remote killline must include a 2"check valve which is in working
condition while drilling. It a checkvalve is crippledfor testingpurposes, the flapper or ball must be
re-installed and tested before drillingresumes.

5. The primarykillline must include a pressure gauge which can display thepump-inpressure onthe
rig floor.

6. Any lines which are installed at the wellhead are designated as "emergencykll!Ilnes" and should
only be used if the primary and remote kill lines are inoperable.|

Figure 11J.11 - Type "B" KIII Line NC - Normally Closed
NO - Normally Open

mps
2" 2"

CheckValves To Remote
KillLine

I

Rev. 1/1/89



CHEVRON DRILLINGREFE CE SERIES
V E ELEVEN

WELL CONTROL AND BLOWOUTPREVENTION

E. CLASS lit BLOWOUT PREVENTER STACK:

The Class 11\preventer stack is designed for Figure 11J.4
drilling or workover operations. It is composed Class 111Blowout Preventer Stack
of a single hydrautically operated annularpre-
venter on top, then a blind ram preventer, a c >
drilling spoot, and a single pipe ram preventer
on bottom. The choke and kill lines are in-
stalled onto the drilling spool and must have a
minimum internal diameter of 2". All side
outlels on the preventers or driffing spoot must
be flanged, studded, or clamped. An emer-
gency kill line may be installed on the wellhead.
A double ram preventer should only be used '

when space limitations make it necessary to
remove the drilling spool, in these Instances,
the choke manifold should be connected to a Annular Preventer
flanged outlet between the preventer rams
only. In this hookup, the pipe rams are
considered master rams only, and cannot be
used to routinely circulate out a kick. The
Clast Ill blowout preventer stack is shown to
the right in Figure 11J.4.

Blind Rams

ipo Rams

I I

Rev. 1/1/89



CHEVRON DR ~ NGREFERENCE SERIES
VOLUME ELE
WELL CONTROLAND BLOWOUT PREVENTION

D. CLASS 111CHOKE MANIFOLD

The Class Ill choke manifold is suitable for Class Illworkovers and drilling operations. The Standard
Class lit choke manifold is shown in Figure 11J.8 below. Specific design features of the Class Ill
manifold include:

1. The manifoldis attached to a drillingspool or the top ram preventer side outlet.

2. The minimun internal diameter is 2" (nominal) for outlets, flanges, valves and lines.

3. Includes twosteel gate valves in the choke line at the drillingspool outlet. The 1nsidechoke line
valve may be remotely controlled(HCR).

4. Includes two manually adjustable chokes which are installed on both side of the manifoldcross.
Steel Isolation gate valves are Installed between both chokes and the cross, and also downstream
of both chokes.

5. Includes a blooey line which runs straight throughthe cross and is isolated by a steel gate valve.

6. Includes a valve isolated pressure gauge suitable for drilling service which can display the casing
pressure within view of the choke operator.

7. Returns throughthe choke manifold mustbe divertible througha mud-gas seperator and then
be routed toeither the shale shaker or the reserve pit througha buffertankor manifoldarrangement.

8. If the choke manifold is remote from the wellhead, a third master valve should be installed
Immediately upstream of the manifoldcross.

Figure 11J.8 - Class 111Choke Manifold NC = Normally Closed
NO = NormallyOpen

AdjustaNble Choke §

2• NO'

2" Nominal
2- Nc 2 Nominal

AdjustablecChoke

Rev.



ATTACilMENT"E"

CHEVRONDRILLINGREFERENCE SERIES
VOLUMEELEVEN

WELL CONTROL AND BLOWOUT PREVENTION

9. BOP CLOSING EQUIPMENT

A. General Roquiromonts

The accumulator system and pumps must be of adoquato capacity for the IDOP stack in uso. The

systemmusthold!pressure without leaks or excessivo pumping and should maintain enough plossure

capacity reserve to close the preventers willi the rocharging pumps turned off. Ihose pumps are

designed tocharge the accumulator within a reasonable timeperiod and maintain thischargo during

preventer operations.

Chevron's design base for surfaco accumulator capacity is governed by MMS rogulation,Order

30 CFR Part 250.56 (d), which states that allblowout preventer systems shall bo equipped with:

Minerals Management Servico Sizing Guidolines

"A hydraulic actuating system that providos sufficient accumulator capacity to

supply 1.5 timestlie volume necessary to close and hold closed allUOP equipment

units with a minimum (remaining) pressure of 200 psi (1,400 kPa) above tito
precharge pressure without assistance from thecharging system. An accumulator

backup systomwhich shall be automatic, supplied by a power source indopendent

from the power source to the primary accumulator chargijig systent, and possess
sufficionicapacityto close all blowout preventors and hókl themclosed.

The abovestated MMSregulation is equivaleni tosizinga 3000 psi accumulator with enoughcapacity

toclose the annular and all ram proventers one timo,with the pumps out of service, white maintaining

a minimumremaining operaling pressure of 1500 psi. This equivalence is shown on the next page.

This demanding base using a 50°/. safoty factor is recommondod by Chovron becauso 11providos

complete replonishment of fluid in"closo"lines at the timoprovonters ato activatod. The satety factor

also allows for loss of fluid capacity due to"interflow"In the four- way valves and possible loss through

the packing of the proventer units. A less domanding base is not reconunended, but may be used ,

with Class 11stacks, provided prior management approval has been obtained. Requiloments vary

with the sil.o of proventors and aro principally controlled by the annular preventer requitelnents.

Opening/closing volumo tables provide tho necessary informalion to calcùlate individual require-

monts as to accumulator sizo needed. Hydraulically operated choko and killlistevalves require added
fluid capacity. It must be remembered that only one-halt to two- thilds of the accumulator bottle is

liquid filled when tuttycharged, depending on the unit.

Rev 1/1/80
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GEOTßGIC PROGRAM

Field/Area Wonsits Valley Federal Unit Exp1/Dev Development

well Name WVFU#121

Location: See 14 TwP 8S Range 21E
Co Uintah state Utah
surface 660' FWL, 2180' FSL
Bottom Hole 660' FWL, 2180' FSL

Elevation: GL estimated 4855 surveyed
KB estimated 4867 Surveyed

Total Depth 5500 Fm at TD Green River

Objectives: PrimaryG1
Secondary E5 F2

Coring: Formation Estimated Depth Amount
Interval/on show None
Interva1/on show
Interval/on show
Interval/on show
Interval/on show

Drill Sten Testing None

Mud Logging 1000' to TD

Electric logging: Surface Intermediate Total Depth
1) DIL-SP -GR 5500'- sur. Casing
2) DIL-MSFL-SP
3) BBC w/GR, Cal.
4) LDT-CNL w/GR, ca1· 5500'-Sur, casing
5) FDC-CNL w/GR, Cal.
6) Dipmeter
7) Velocity survey
8) RFT
9) Microlog 5500'-1QQQ'

10)
11)

All runs from TD to either base of surface casing or overlap with previous
log run unless otherwise noted.



GEOLOGIC PROGRAM (Continued)

Tops:
Estimated Sample Log

Formation Depth, datum Depth, datum Depth, datum

Green River ??S6'
F5 5099'
F2 5170'
F4 5250'
Gl lime 5275'
Gl sand 5287'

Correlation Wells:
Correlative Zones with Subject Well
Fm Interval

1) Gulf Oil Green River 2246' -Erimany-obé••t-i-ve---

WVFU #35 ES 5082 '
--sonee-to-be-eeeek-

NESW14-85-21E F2 5148'
Gl lime 5249'

2) Gulf Oil Green River 2227'
WVFU #68 E5 5068 '

-senee-to-be-eere
-

NESE 15-8S-21E F2 5137'
Gl Time 5236'

DIVISION OF INTEREST:
Working Interest Partners:
chevron 100 I I I

I I

Others Receiving Data:

REMARKS:

Prepared by Bob Rector Date 7/5/89
Reviewed by . Date

Formation Evaluation Analyst

Approved Date
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CHEVRONU.S.A. INC.

WONSITSVALLEYFEDERALUNIT 121
SEC. 14, T8S, R21E

UINTAHCOUNTY,UTAH
MULTIPOINTSURFACEUSE PLAN

1. EXISTING ROADS

A. See Topo maps "A" and "B". We do not plan to change, alter or improve upon
any existing state or county roads.

B. From Vernal, Utah, go southwest approximately 36.3 miles. Turn left, travel
±300' to proposed access road.

2. PLANNEDACCESSROADS

From the entrance the proposed access road is to go approximately 234' southwest.
Existing and planned access roads in the Unit will be maintained in accordance
with Bureau of Land Management & BIA requirements. See Topo Map "B".

A. Width: Maximum width 30' with an 18' travel area.
B. Maximum Grade: No greater than 8%.
C. Turnouts: None, avoid blind corners.
D. Drainage Design: Roads to be placed and constructed so that minimal drainage

alterations will be made. Water will be diverted around well pad as necessary.
E. No major cuts and fills.
F. Surfacing Materials: Gravel if necessary (see item 6-A).
G. Other: No gates, cattleguards or fence cuts.

3. LOCATIONOF EXISTING WELLS

See Topo Map "B".

4. LOCATIONOF EXISTING AND/0R PROPOSEDFACILITIES

A. See Exhibit "D".

B. Install new flowline from subject well a distance of 4,282,59' to the north
and west to Tank Battery 5 as shown on Exhibit "D". Flowline will be 3"
plain end welded li,ne pipe, placed on supports on the surface, heat traced,
insulated and wrapped with green childer.

C. Disturbed areas no longer needed for operations will be graded back to as
near original state as possible. Drainage channels will be returned to origi-
nal state and the areas will be reseeded as prescribed by the BIA.

D. A blooie pit 8' x 10' x 5' deep will be constructed 150' to the north of
the center hole as shown on Exhibit "C". A line will be placed on the surface
from the center hole to the burn pit. The pit will be fenced on four sides
to protect livestock.

E. A line heater will be required for the production from this well. About
100' of access will be needed to service this line heater. This will be
adjacent to the pad and placed along the production flowline from this



O O
MULTIPOINTSURFACEUSE PLAN
WVFU121
Page 2

5. LOCATIONANDTYPE OF WATERSUPPLY

A. Water supplied to the location will be hauled by truck on existing roads
in the area from a point in Sec. 13, T7S, R23E, in the NE4SEk. This water
source has been permitted with the Utah State Engineer.

6. SOURCEOF CONSTRUCTIONMATERIALS

A. All Tand is Ute Tribal land. All gravel, cement, etc., needed on the access
road and location will come commercially from the Vernal, Utah area. Access
road needed is shown on Topo map "B".

7. METHODSFOR HANDLINGWASTEDISPOSAL

A. Cuttings will be settled out in the reserve pit. The reserve pit will be
unlined. It will be fenced with a wire mesh fence, topped with at least
one strand of barbed wire.

B. Drilling fluids will be retained in reserve tanks utilizing maximum recircu-
lation during drilling operations. Following drilling, the liquid waste
will be evaporated and the remainder worked into the deep subsoil of the
pit, and the pit filled in and returned to natural grade.

C. In the event fluids are produced, any oil will be retained until sold in
tankage and any water produced will be retained until its quality is dete-
rmined. The quality and quantity of water produced will then determine the
necessary disposal procedure.

D. Sewage will be disposed of in a 1,000 gallon fiber glass insulated holding
tank, which is to be placed in the vicinity of the trailers on the well loca-
tion. Arrangements have been made for the sewage to be transported from
the wellsite to the City of Vernal, Utah, for disposal in the city disposal
system. The sewage will be hauled by an authorized hauling firm.

E. Trash will be contained in a portable metal container and hauled periodically
to an approved disposal dump.

F. After the rig has moved from the wellsite, all waste material will be removed
to an approved disposal dump.

8. ANCILLARYFACILITIES

Because of the accessibility to good roads and relatively close housing, we antici-
pate no need for ancillary facilities with the exception of two trailers to be
located on the drilling site.

9. WELLSITELAYOUT

A. Four to six inches of topsoil will be removed from the location and stockpiled.
Location of mud tanks, reserve, burn and trash pits, pipe racks, living
facilities and soil stockpiles will be located as shown on Exhibit "C".

B. Pits will not be



MULTIPOINTSURFACEUSE PLAN
WVFU121
Page 3

C. Access to the well pad will be as indicated in Exhibit "C".

10. PLANSFOR RESTORATIONOF SURFACE

A. All surface areas not required for producing operations will be graded to
as near original condition as possible and contoured to maintain possible
erosion to a minimum. Any rock encountered in excavation will be disposed
of beneath backfill to return surface to its present appearance and provide
soil for seed growth.

B. The topsoil will be evenly distributed over the disturbed areas. Reseeding
will be performed as directed by the BIA.

C. Pits and any other area that would present a hazard to wildlife or livestock
will be fenced off when the rig is released and removed.

D. Any oil accumulation on the pit will be removed, burned or overhead flagged
as dictated by then existing conditions.

E. The well will be completed during 1989. Rehabilitation will commence following
completion of the well. If the wellsite is to be abandoned, all disturbed
areas will be recontoured to the natural contour as is possible.

11. SURFACEOWNERSHIP

A. The wellsite, access roads, flowlines and powerlines will all be constructed
on BIA owned surfaces. The operator shall contact the BLM office at (801)
789-1362 and the BIA office at (801) 722-2406 between 24 & 48 hours prior
to construction activities.

12. OTHERINFORMATION

A. The well is located on hilly and sandy terrain. Vegetation consists of small
sagebrush and natural grasses around the locations. The soil is a poorly
developed, semi-arid, thin topsoil layer over the Uintah Formation.

B. Surface use activities other than the oil well facilities consist of live-
stock grazing.

C. There are no water bodies or occupied dwellings near the wellsites. Achaeo-
logical, historical and cultural sites may be determined during the field
inspection. An archaeological survey has been conducted on the disturbed
areas and a copy of this report sent to the BLMand the BIA.

13. COMPANYREPRESENTATIVE

Mr. D. F. Forsgren
P.O. Box 599
Denver, CO 80201
(303)
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MULTIPOINTSURFACEUSE PLAN
WVFU121
Page 4

I hereby certify that I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the
proposed drillsite and access route; that I am familiar with the conditions which
presently exist; that the statements made in this plan are, to the best of my know-
ledge, true and correct; and, that the work associated with the operations proposed
herein will be performed by Chevron U.S.A. Inc. and its contractors and subcontractors
in conformity with this plan and the terms and conditions under which it is approved.

Date D. F. o gren
Environment, Safety, Fire & Health Coordinator

DFF:kh

Map "A" - Proposed Location
Map "B" - Proposed Access Road
Exhibit "C" - Location Layout and Cut and Fill
Exhibit "D" - Proposed
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Sec 10 COMBINED ÈRODUCTIONFACILITIES
SE i/4 & LOCATIONDAMAGEAREA

(For Wonsits Valley Unit #121)
UTE

TRIBAL LOCATEDIN
SECTIONS 10, 14, & 15, T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M.
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statPofUtah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

Norman H. Bangerter
Governor

Dee C. Hansen 355 West North Temple

Executive Director 3 Triad Center, Suite 350

Dianne R.Nielson, Ph.D. Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

Division Director 801-538-5340

August 18, 1989

Chevron USA Incorporated
P. O. Box 599
Denver, Colorado 80201

Gentlemen:

Re: WVU#121 - NW SW Sec. 14, T. 8S, R. 21E - Uintah County, Utah
2313' FSL, 653' FWL

Approval to drill the referenced well is hereby granted in accordance with Section
40-6-18, Utah Code Annotated, as amended 1983; and predicated on Rule R615-2-3,Oil
and Gas Conservation General Rules, subject to the following stipulation:

1. Prior to commencement of drilling, receipt by the Division of evidence
providing assurance of an adequate and approved supply of water as
required by Chapter 3, Title 73, Utah Code Annotated.

In addition, the following actions are necessary to fully comply with this approval:

1. Spudding notification within24 hours after drilling operations commence.

2. Submittal of an Entity Action Form within five working days following
spudding and whenever a change in operations or interests necessitates an
entity status change.

3. Submittál of the Report of Water Encountered During Drilling, Form 7.

4. Prompt notification if it is necessary to plug and abandon the well. Notify
John R. Baza, Petroleum Engineer, (Office) (801) 538-5340, (Home)
298-7695, or Jim Thompson, Lead Inspector, (Home) 298-93\8.

5. Compliance with the requirements of Rule R6l5-3-20, Gas Flaring or Venting,
Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules.

an equal opportunity



Page 2
Chevron USA Incorporated
WVU #121
August 18, 1989

6. Prior to commencement of the proposed drilling operations, plans for facilities
for disposal of sanitary wastes at the drill site shall be submitted to the local
health department. These drilling operations and any subsequent well
operations must be conducted in accordance with applicable state and local
health department regulations. A list of local health departments and copies
of applicable regulations are available from the Division of Environmental
Health, Bureau of General Sanitation, telephone (801)538-6121.

7. This approval shall expire one (1) year after date of issuance unless
substantial and continuous operation is underway or an application for an
extension is made prior to the approval expiration date.

The API number assigned to this well is 43-047-31873.

Sincerely,

. . i h
Associate Director, Oil & Gas

Icr
Enclosures '

cc: Bureau of Land Management
D. R. Nielson
J. L. Thompson



SUBMIT IN ATE• Form approved.Form 3160-3
(Other Instruct e on Budget Bureau No. 1004-0136°"",be UNITED STATES reverse side) Expires August 31, 1985

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR o. x,.a....8IGNATION AND BERIAL NO.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT \)-0807

APPLICATION FOR PERMITTO DRILL,DEEPEN,OR PLUGBACK 6.IFINDIAN,ALLOTTERORTRIBENAME

18. TTPE OF WORK

DRILLŒ DEEPENO Ù<hB UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

b. Trrzorwar,t, ORSits Valley Federal
OIL GAg SI MULTIPL PARM OR LEASE NAME
WELL WELL OTHER EON Ñ 1

2. NAME OF OPERATOR AUG a 1 Wonsits Valley
Chevron USA Inc., Room 13097 9. WEL NO.

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR

P.0. Box 599, Denver, CO 80201 01LGAS&MINING 1Û. FIELD AND POOI., OE WILDCAT

4. LocATroN or wmLL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements-*) WORSitS/Green Ri Ver
At surface

653' FWL 2313' FSL (NW, SW) 11...c.,2.,a.,..,on.ma.
AND BURVEY OB ABEA

At proposed prod. zone
653' FWL, 2313' FSL (NW, SW) (f_ pç 7 ])?7 Sec. 14-T8S-R21E

14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEABEST TOWN OB POST OFFIca* 12. COUNTT OR PABISH 18. BTATE

±40 miles south of Vernal, UT Uintah Utah
10. DISTANCE PROM PROPOSED* 16. NO. OF ACBES IN LEASE 17. NO. OF ACRES ASSIGNED

LOCATION TO NEAREST TO THIS WELL
PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE. FT. AO 11
(Also to nearest drlg. unit line, if any)

18. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED LOCATION* 19. PROPOSED DEPTH 2Û. ROTARY OR CABLE TOOLS
TO NEAREST WELL, DRILLING. COMPLETED,
OR APPLIED FOR, ON THIS 12 ==. rr. 5700 Rotary

21. ELEVATIONs (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 22. APPROI. DATE WORK WILL START*

4855' GL (est) 4870' KB (est) 9-15-89
23. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

SIEE OF HOLE SIZE OF CASING WEIGHT PER FOOT BETTING DEPTH QUANTITY OF CEMENT

124 9-5/8" 36# ± 500 to surfare
8-3/4 7" 23 & 26# ±5700' to surface

It is proposed to drill this development well to a depth of 5700' to test the
Green River formation.

Attachments: Certified Plat
Drilling Program
chevronClass III B0PE y¾
Geologic Program
Multipoint Surface Use Plan

Completion Procedure to be submitted by Sundry Notice.

IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM : If proposal is to deepen or plug back, give data on present productive sone and proposed new productive
zone. If proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give pertinent data on subsurface locations and measured and trite vertical depths. Give blowout
preventer program, if any.

SIGNED TITI. Technical Assistant .
7-8-89

(Th pace for Federal or State otBee use)

PWR3tiT NO APPROVAT DATE

APPROVED BY TITL

COND S F P O L IF

MOM OF APPROVALATTACHED
,

TOOPERATOR'SCOPY
UTDSO9413(o *SeeInskuctionsOn ReverseSide

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the
nite s v false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its



Form approved.

Form 31tiO-s UNI STATES SUBMIT IN TRIPL *
Dudget Bureau No. 1004-0135

November 1983) (Other instructions Expires August 31, 1985

Formerly 9-331) DEPARTMEN THE INTERIOR rerse side) a. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SBRIAL NO.

BUREAUOFLANDMANAGEMENT U-0807

SUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTS S
$• IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE 05 TRIBE NAME

(Do not use this form for pro osals to drill or to deepen or plug b r e
Use "APPL CATION FOR FERMIT-" for sue

1. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

°w'.i.. U °w^.'st O OTHEE SUG0 3 Qa Wonsits Valley Federal
i NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FARM 08 LEASE NAME

Chevron U.S.A. Inc., Room 13097 page , Wonsits Valley
i SDDREBB Or OPERATOR

** a 9. WELL NO.

P.O. Box 599, Denver, CO 80201 .AAS&MWING 121
4. LOÒATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10. rlELD AND POOL, OE WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
at surtne• Wonsits/Green River

11. ase., 2., a., x., os ar.x. Ann

653' FWLand 2,313' FSL
""°¯

Sec. 14, T8S, R21E
14. PERMIT No. 15. EtÆVATIONs (Show whether or, NT, GR, etc.) 12. COUNTY OR PARISH 18. STATE

43-047-31873 U.GR: 4,855' Uintah Utah
16 OCk Appropriate BoxTo Indicate NatureoFNotice, Report, or OtherData

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: 80BBEQUENT REPORT 07:

TEST WATER SBUT-Orr PCLL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHOT-Orr
. REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT 31ULTIPLE COMPI.ETE FRACTURE TREATMENT AI.TERING CAglNG

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIEING ABANDONMENT

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)
(Norm: Report resuÍts of multipÏàcomplètion on Wel

(Other) Suppl ement A. P. D• Completion or Recompleti n Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CO3tPLETED OPERATIoNs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including.estilnatéa date of startinjr any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical deptha for alf markers and gones perti-
nent to this work.) *

As requested, the following information is provided to facilitate approval of the
subject wells retained A.P.D. (Please refer to 3162.31 UTO8438).

1.) BIA right-of-way application is in the hands of the Tribal Council awaiting
approval.

2.) Anticipated BHP - 1,500 psi.
3.) Casing to be utilized will be new casing.
4.) Please reference the attached Class III choke manifold schematic. In particular,

note the utilizatin of a 3" choke line with 2-3" choke valves.

BUR OF LANDMAMGEMENT
AX venNAL UTAN

18. I hereby certify at the fore oing true and correct

SIGNED / .7 TITLE Technical Assistant ,,,,
9-20-89

(This spac or Federal or State ofSce use)

APPROVED BY #M TITLE DATR S

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF :

0 ^^1 *See Instructionson ReverseSide
op-g9-,to

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the
United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its



CHEVRON DglNG REFERENCE SERIES
VOLUMEELEVEN
WELLCONTROL ANDBLOWOUT PREVENTION

D. CLASS IIICHOKE MANIFOLD

The Class IIIchoke manifoldis suitablefor Class Illworkovers anddrillingoperations. The Standard
Class Ill choke manifoldis shown in Figure 11J.8 below. Specific design features of the Class 1|\

manifold include:

1. The manifold is attached to a drillingspool or the top ram preventer side outlet.

2. The minimuninternal diameter is 2" (nominal) for outlets, flanges, valves and lines.

3. Includes twosteel gate valves in the choke line at the drillingspooloutlet. The inside choke line

valve maybe remotely controlled(HCR).

4. Includes twomanuallyadjustablechokes which are installed on both side ofthe manifoldcross.
Steel isolation gate valves are installed between both chokesand the cross, and also downstream
of both chokes.

5. Includes a blooey line which runs straight throughthe cross and is isolated by a steel gate valve.

6. Includes a valve isolated pressure gauge suitable for drilling servicewhichcan display the casing
pressure within view of the chokeoperator.

7. Returns throughthe choke manifoldmust be divertible througha mud-gas seperator and then
be routed toeither theshale shaker or the reserve pitthrougha buffertankor manifoldarrangement.

8. If the choke manifold is remote from the wellhead, a thirdmaster valve should be installed
immediately upstream of the manifoldcross.

Figure 11J.8 - Class IIIChoke Manifold NC = Normally Closed
NO = NormallyOpen

AdjustaNble Choke

2 No o

3"Nominal 2 Nc 2" Nominal

AdjustablecChoke

Rev. 1/1/89



· O uaD STATESGOVERNMENT

memorandum
July 17, 1990

REPLY 'T
ATTN OF: . tendent, Uintah & Ouray Agency

SUR.lECT: ROW-89-158, Chevron U.S.A. Inc.
Section 10, 14, & 15, T. 8S., R. 21E.

'°° Bureau Of Land Management, Vernal District Office
Attn: Paul Andrews

We (concur with) (recamendl approval of the Application for Permit
to drill on the subject well (sl.

Based on available information on July 17, 1990, we have cleared the proposed
locations in the following areas of environmental impact.

YES_ XX_ NO Listed Threatened or Endangered Species
YES XX NO Critical Wildlife Habitat
YES XX NO Archeological or Cultural Resources
YES NO Air Quality Aspects (to be used only if

project is in or adjacent to a Class 1 Acre of
Attaininent)

YES NO Other (If necessary)

OPTIONAL FORM NO. 10
(REV. 1-80)
GSA FPMR (41 CFR) 101-11.6
5010-114

U.S. GPO-
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CONDITIONSOF APPROVALFOR NOTICETO DRILL

Company Chevron USA Inc Well No. 121

Location NW/SW Sec. 14 T8S R21E Lease No. U-0807

Approval of this application does not warrant or certify that the applicant
holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which
would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full
compliance is made with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore
Oil and Gas Orders, and the approved plan of operations. The operator is fully
responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy of these conditions
will be furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

Be aware fire restrictions may be in effect when location is being constructed
and/or whenwell is being drilled. Contact the appropriate Surface Management
Agency for information.

A. DRILLINGPROGRAM

1. Estimated Depth at Which Oil, Gas, Water, or Other Mineral Bearing
2ones are Expected to be Encountered

Report ALL water shows and water-bearing sands to Tim Ingwell of
this office. Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable.
If noticeable water flows are detected, submit samples to this
office along with any water analyses conducted.

All usable water and prospectively valuable minerals (as described
by BLMat onsite) encountered during drilling, will be recorded by
depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be
tested to determine commercial potential.

2. Pressure Control Equipment

The BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimum requirements
of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 for equipment and testing
requirements, procedures, etc. and individual components shall be
operable as designed.

The Vernal District Office shall be notified, with sufficient lead
time, in order to have a BLMrepresentative on location during
pressure testing.

3. Casing Program and Auxiliary Equipment

Surface casing shall have centralizers on the bottom three joints,
with a minimum of one centralizer per
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Usable water may be encountered from +923-993 ft. and +1113-1293 ft.
in the Uinta Formation and from +399824233 ft. and +5350-5700 ft. in
the Green River formation. The Mahoganyoil shale ind L1 oil shale
have been identified from +3455-3575 ft. and +3655-3755 ft.
respectively. If encountered, these resourcei will need to be
isolated and/or protected via the cementing program for the
production casing.

The District Office shalT be notified, with sufficient lead time, in
order to have a BLMrepresentative on location while running all
casing strings and cementing.

4. MudProgram and Circulating Medium

No chromate additives will be used in the mud system on Federal and
Indian lands without prior BLMapproval to ensure adequate protection
of fresh water aquifers.

5. Coring, Logging and Testing Program

Daily drilling and completion progress reports shall be submitted to
this office on a weekly basis.

A cement bond log (CBL) shall be utilized to determine the 141) of
cement (TOC) for the intermediate and production casing.

Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well
Completion and Recompletion Report and Log" (Form 3160-4) will be
submitted not later than 30 days after completion of the well cn'
after completion of operations being performed, in accordance with 43
CFR 3164. Two copies of all logs, core descriptions, core analyses,
well-test data, geologic summaries, sample description, and all other
surveys or data obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover,
and/or completion operations, will be filed with Form 3160-4.
Samples (cuttings, fluids, and/or gases) will be submitted when
requested by the Authorized Officer (AO).

6. Notifications of Operations

No location will be constructed or moved, no well will be plugged, and
no drilling or workover equipment will be removed from a well to be
placed in a suspended status without prior approval of the A0. If
operations are to be suspended, prior approval of the A0 will be
obtained and notification given before resumption of operations.

The spud date will be reported orally to the A0 within 48 hours after
spudding. If the spudding occurs on a weekendor holiday, the report
will be submitted on the following regular work day. The oral report
will be followed up with a Sundry Notice.

Operator shall report production data to MMSpursuant to 30 CFR 216.5
using form
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Immediate Report: Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents, or any
other unusual occurrences shall be promptly reported in accordance
with the requirements of NTL-3Aor its revision.

If a replacement rig is contemplated for completion operations, a
"Sundry Notice" (Form 3160-5) to that effect will be filed, for prior
approval of the AO, and all conditions of this approved plan are
applicable during all operations conducted with the replacement rig.

Should the well be successfully completed for production, the A0 will
be notified when the well is placed in a producing status. Such noti-
fication will be sent by telegram or other written canmunication, not
later than five (5) days following the date on which the well is
placed on production.

Pursuant to NTL-28, with the approval of a District Engineer, produced
water may be temporarily disposed of into unlined pits for a period of
up to 90 da.ys. During the period so authorized, an application for
approval of the permanent disposal method, along with the required
water analysis and other information, must be submitted to the
District Engineer.

Gas produced from this well may not be vented or flared beyond an
initial authorized test period of 30 days or 50 MMCFfollowing its
completion, whichever occurs first, without the prior written appro-
val of the Authorized Officer. Should gas be vented or flared with-
out approval beyond the authorized test period, the operator may be
directed to shut-in the well until the gas can be captured or appro-
val to continue venting or flaring as uneconomic is granted and the
operator shall be required to compensate the lessor for that portion
of the gas vented or flared without approval which is determined to
have been avoidably lost.

A schematic facilities diagram as required by 43 CFR 3162.7-2, 3162.
7-3, and 3162.7-4 shall be submitted to the appropriate District
Office within 30 days of installation or first production, whichever
occurs first. All site security regulations as specified in Onshore
Oil and Gas Order No. 3 shall be adhered to. All product lines
entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will be effectively
sealed in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-4.

No well abandonment operations will be commencedwithout the prior
approval of the A0. In the case of newly drilled dry holes or fail-

ures, and in emergency situations, oral approval will be obtained
from the AO. A "Subsequent Report of Abandonment" Form 3160-5, will
be filed with the A0 within 30 days following completion of the well
for abandonment. This report will indicate where plugs were placed
and the current status of surface restoration. Final abandonment will
not be approved until the surface reclamation wort required by the
approved APD or approved abandonmentnotice has been completed to the
satisfaction of the A0 or his representative, or the appropriate
Surface Managing
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Pursuant to Onshore Oil and Gas Orders, lessees and operators have the
responsibility to see that their exploration, development, production,
and construction operations are conducted in a manner which conforms
with applicable Federal laws and regulations and with State and local
laws and regulations to the extent that such State and local laws are
applicable to operations on Federal or Indian lands.

7. Other Information

All loading lines will be placed inside the berm surrounding the tank
battery.

All site security guidelines identified in Onshore Oil and Gas Order
No. 3 regulations will be adhered to.

All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on-lease
or off-lease will have prior written approval from the AO.

Gas meter runs for each well will be located within 500 feet of the
wellhead. The gas flowline will be buried or anchored down from the
wellhead to the meter and 500 feet downstream of the meter run or any
production facilities. Meter runs will be housed and/or fenced.

The oil and gas measurement facilities will be installed on the well
location. The oil and gas meters will be calibrated in place prior
to any deliveries. Tests for meter accuracy will be conducted monthly
for the first three months on new meter installations and at least
quarterly thereafter. The A0 will be provided with a date and time
for the initial meter calibration and all future meter proving
schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will be submitted
to the Vernal District Office. All meter measurement facilities will
conform with the Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 4 for liquid hydrocar-
bons and Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 5 for natural gas measurement.

The use of materials under BLMjurisdiction will conform to 43 CFR
3610.2-3.

There will be no deviation from the proposed drilling and/or workover
program without prior approval from the AO. Safe drilling and
operating practices must be observed. All wells, whether drilling,
producing, suspended, or abandoned will be identified in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.

"Sundry Rotice and Report on Wells" (Form 3160-5) will be filed for
approval for all changes of plans and other operations in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.3-2.

Section 102(b)(3) of the Federal Oil and Gas Royalty Management Act of
1982, as implemented by the applicable provisions of the operating
regulations at Title 43 CFR 3162.4-1(c), requires that "not later
than the 5th business day after any well begins production on which
ro.yalty is due anywhere on a lease site or allocated to a lease site,
or resumes production in the case of a well which has been off
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tion for more than 90 days, the operator shall notify the authorized
officer by letter or sundry notice, Form 3160-5, or orally to be
followed by a letter or sundry notice, of the date on which such
production has begun or resumed."

The date on which production is commencedor resumed will be construed
for oil wells as the date on which liquid hydrocarbons are first sold
or shipped from a temporary storage facility, such as a test tank,
and for which a run ticket is required to be generated or, the date
on which liquid hydrocarbons are first produced into a permanent
storage facility, whichever first occurs; and, for gas wells as the
date on which associated liquid hydrocarbons are first sold or ship-
ped from a temporary storage facility, such as a test tank, and for
which a run ticket is required to be generated or, the date on which
gas is first measured through permanent metering facilities, which-
ever first occurs.

If you fail to comply with this requirement in the manner and time
allowed, you shall be liable for a civil penalty of up to $10,000 per
violation for each day such violation continues, not to exceed a maxi-
mumof 20 days. See Section 109(c)(3) of the Federal Oil and Gas
Ro.yalty Management Act of 1982 and the implementing regulations at
Title 43 CFR 3162.4-1(b)(5)(ii).

APD approval is valid for a period of one (1) year from the signature
date. An extension period may be granted, if requested, prior to the
expiration of the original approval period.

In the event after-hour approvals are necessary, please contact one
of the following individuals:

Gerald E. Kenczka (801 ) 781-1190
Petroleum Engineer

Ed Forsman (801) 789-7077
Petroleum Engineer

FAXPhone Number is:
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Revised October 1, 1985

Date APD Received 8/14/89

CONDITIONSOF APPROVAL
FOR TH OF THE

¯ APPLICATIONFORPERMIT TO DRILL

Company/0perator Chevron USA

Well Name& Number Wonsits Valley Federal Unit #121

Lease Number U-0807

Location NW 1/4 L1/4 Sec. 14 T. 8 S. R. 21 E.

Surface Ownership Indian Lands Administered by the
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B. TRIRTEENPOINT SURFACEUSE PROGRAM:

1. Location of Existing and/or Proposed Facilities

Any storage facility/battery constructed on this lease must be
surrounded by a containment structure. The containment structure
must have sufficient volume to contain, at a minimum, the entire
content of the largest tank with the storage facility/battery.

All permanent (on site for six months or longer) structures con-
structed or installed (including pumping units) will be painted a
flat, non-reflective, earthtone color to match one of the standard
environmental colors, as determined by the Rocky Mountain Five State
Interagency Committee. All facilities will be painted within 6
months of installation. Facilities required to comply with 0.S.H.A.
(Occupational Safety and Health Act) will be excluded.

2. Methods for Handling Waste Disposal

Burning will not be allowed. All trash must be contained in a trash
cage and hauled away to an approved disposal site at the completion
of the drilling activities.

On BLMadministered lands:

The reserve pit shall be lined. because of the sandy soils. A blooie
pit will be constructed 150 feet from the center hole and used for
rig safety reasons during drilling.

The reserve pit will be lined to conserve water (because of operator's
request). A 10 mil liner was suggested at the onsite. Bursh needs
to be cleared out of pit prior to its installation. If a plastic
nylon reinforced liner is used it shall be torn and perforated before
backfilling of the reserve pit.

Produced waste water will be confined to a lined pit or, if deemed
necessary, a storage tank for a period not to exceed 90 days after
first production. During the 90-day period an application for
approval of a permanent disposal method and location, along with
required water analysis, will be submitted for the A0's approval.
Failure to file an application within the time allowed will be
considered an incident of noncompliance.

Production facilities - More than one pit for produced water on
production facilites must be justified.

3. Well Site Layout

All pits will be fenced with a wire mesh fence and topped with at
least one strand of barbed wire. The reserve pit fencing will be on
three sides during drilling operations and on the fourth side when
the rig moves off the location. Any hydrocarbons on the pit will be
removed from the pit as soon as possible after drilling operations
are completed. Pits will be fenced and maintained until
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The fence will be constructed as prescribed in the USGSPublication
(1978) Surface Operating Standards for Oil and Gas Development.
Alternatives to the prescribed standards shall be submitted to the
Authorized Officer for approval.

The stockpiled topsoil will be stored on the: east and west sides of
the location.

Access to the well pad will be as indicated in the APD. A blooie pit
will be constructed 150 feet from the center hole and used for safety
reasons during drilling activities.

4. Plans for Restoration of Surface

A. Provide a restoration program upon completion of operations,
including:

(1) Backfilling, leveling, recontouring, and waste disposal;
segregation of topsoil from cut materials as needed

(2) Revegetation and rehabilitation--including abandoned access
roads or portions of well pads no longer needed (normally
per BLMrecommendations)

(3) Proposed timetable for commencementand completion of
rehabilitation operations

B. The following are provisions to be addressed in the restoration
plan:

Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area
will be cleared of all debris, materials, trash and junk not required
for production.

Before any dirt work to restore the location takes place, the reserve
pit must be completely dry and all cans, barrels, pipe, etc. will be
removed. The reserve pit and that portion of the location and access
road not needed for production facilities/operations will be reclaim-
ed. The reserve pit will be reclaimed within 1 year from the date of
well completion.

All disturbed areas will be recontoured to the approximate natural
contours.

The stockpiled topsoil will be evenly distributed over the disturbed
areas.

Prior to reseeding, all disturbed areas, including the access roads,
will be scarified and left with a rough surface.

Seed will be broadcast or drilled at a time specified by the BIA. If
broadcast, a harrow or some other implement will be dragged over the
seeded area to assure seed coverage and the seed mixture will be
proportionately larger (double the 1bs. per
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An appropriate seed mixture will be determined by the BIA either as
part of the Conditions of Approval of the APD or at the time
restoration activities are scheduled to begin.

At such time as the well is plugged and abandoned, the operator will
submit a surface reclamation plan to the Surface Management Agency
for prescribed seed mixtures and reseeding requirements.

If the seeding is unsuccessful, the lessee/operator may be required to
make subsequent seedings.

On BIA administered lands:

Abandoned well sites, roads, or other disturbed areas will be restored
to near their original condition. This procedure will include: (a)
reestablishing irrigation systems where applicable, (b) re-establish-
ing soil conditions in irrigated fields in such a way as to insure
cultivation and harvesting of crops and, (c) insuring revegetation of
the disturbed areas to the specifications of the Ute Indian Tribe or
the BIA at the time of abandonment.

The operator will submit a plan of controlling noxious weeds along
rights-of-way for roads, pipelines, well sites or other applicable
facilities. A list of noxious weeds can be obtained fram the
appropriate county extension office.

5. Other Additional Information

A cultural resource clearance will be required before any
construction begins on Federal and Indian lands. However, historic
and cultural resource work shall be undertaken only with the
written consent of a private surface owner. If the private surface
owner refuses entry for that purpose, the lessee or operator shall
use its best efforts to conduct its approved operations in a manner
that avoids adverse effects on any properties which are listed, or
may be eligible for listing, in the NRHP.

If, during operations, any archaeological or historical sites, or
any object of antiquit,y (subject to the Antiquities Act of June 8,
1906) are discovered, all operations which would affect such sites
are to be suspended and the discovery reported promptly to the
Surface Management Agency.

The operator will control noxious weeds along rights-of-way for
roads, pipelines, well sites or other applicable facilities. A
list of noxious weeds may be obtained from the BLM, BIA, FS, or the
appropriate County Extension Office. On BLMadministerd land it is
required that a Pesticide Use Proposal shall be submitted, and
given approval, prior to the application of herbicides or other
pesticides or possible hazardous chemicals.

On BIA administered land:

Operator's employees, including subcontractors, will not gather
firewood along roads constructed by operators. If wood cutting
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required, a permit will be obtained from the Forestry Department of
the BIA pursuant to 25 CFR 169.13 "Assessed Damages Incident to
Right-of-Way Authorization". All operators, subcontractors,
vendors and their employees or agents may not disturb saleable
timber (including firewood) without a duly granted wood permit from
the BIA Forester.

If the surface rights are owned by the Ute Indian Tribe and mineral
rights are owned by another entity, an approved rights-of-way will
be obtained from the BIA before the operator begins any construction
activities. If the surface is owned by another entity and the
mineral rights are owned by the Ute Indian Tribe, rights-of-way
will be obtained from the other entity.

All roads constructed by operators on the Uintah and Ouray Indian
Reservation will have appropriate signs. Signs will be neat and of
sound construction. They will state: (a) that the land is owned
by the Ute Indian Tribe, (b) the name of the operator, (c) that
firearms are prohibited to all non-Ute Tribal members, (d) that
penmits must be obtained from the BIA before cutting firewood or
other timber products and (e) only authorized personnel permitted.

All well site locations on the Uintah and Ouray Indian Reservation
will have an appropriate sign indicating the nameof the operator,
the lease serial number, the well name and number, the survey
description of the well (either footages or the quarter-quarter
section, the section, township, and range).

Additional Surface Stipulations for BLM, BIA, FS, DWR,or Private
Surface Lands:

The operator or his contractor shall contact the BLMand BIA
Offices at (801) 789-1362 (BLM) and (801 ) 722-2406 (BIA) between 24
and 48 hours prior to construction activities. Contact the Book
Cliffs Resource Area.

Drilling rigs and/or equipment used during drilling operations on
this wellsite will not be stacked or stored on Federal Lands after
the conclusion of drilling operations or at any other time without
BLMauthorization. However, if BLMauthorization is obtained, it
is only a temporary measure to allow time to make arrangements for
permanent storage on commercial facilities. (The BLMdoes not seek
to compete with private industry. There are commercial facilities
available for stacking and storing drilling rigs.

The operator is responsible for informing all persons in the area
who are associated with this project that they will be subject to
prose- cution for knowingly disturbing historic or archaeological
sites, or for collecting artifacts. If historic or archaeological
materials are uncovered during construction, the operator is to
immediately stop work that might further disturb such materials,
and contact the authorized officer (AO). Within five working days
the A0 will inform the operator as
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-whether the materials appear eligible for the National
Register of Historic Places;

-the mitigation measures the operator will likely have to
undertake before the site can be used (assuming in situ
preservation is not necessary); and

-a time frame for the A0 to complete an expedited revew under
36 CFR 800.11 to confirm, through the State Historic
Preservation Officer, that the findings of the A0 are correct
and that mitigation is appropriate.

If the operator wishes, at any time, to relocate activities to
avoid the expense of mitgation and/or the delays associated with
this pro- cess, the A0 will assume responsibility for whatever
recordation and stabilization of the exposed materials may be
required. Otherwise, the operator will be responsible for
mitigation costs. The A0 will provide technical and prcedural
guidelines for the conduct of mitiga- tion. Upon verification from
the A0 that required mitigation has been completed, the operator
will then be allowed to resume construction.

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner
that full compliance is made with all applicable laws, regulations,
Onshore Oil and Gas Orders, the approved plan of operations, and
any applicable Notice to Lessees. The operator is fully
responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy of these
conditions will be furnished the field representative to insure
compliance.

The dirt contractor will be provided with an approved copy of the
Surface Use Plan from the APD.

This drilling permit will be valid for a period of one year from
the date of approval. After permit termination, a new application
will be filed for approval for any future
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L Recompicuon
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Tatie 18 U S.C. Secoon 1001. nains it a cntne for any person knowingly and wt y to trake to any tut Ásise.ficacous or fraud cnt sute ne

of reowmoons as to sav c·zust withis its
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DIVISIONOFOIL,GASANDNINING API NO. 43-047-31873

SPUDDIN6INFORM4TION

NAFEOFCOPPANY: CHEVRON U.S.A., INC.

WELLM: WONSIT VALLEY UNIT #121

SECTIONRwsw 14 TOWNSHIP88 PANGE 21E COUNTYUINTAR

DRILLINGCONTRACTOREXËTER

RIG# 7

SPUDDED:DATE 9-30-90

TIME 11:00 p.m.

ÑOW RoTARY

DRILLING WILLCOMMENCEHad to.call operator for spud repo t.

EPORTEDBY Jeannie

TELEPHONEÑ

DATË 10-26-90 SIGNED
.



aanlL UI UlÄll
olvlSÏ0N Of OIL, GAS AND MINING OPERATOR Chevron U.S.A. Inc· oeERAloa Acci. No. H (7,1/23 .

ENTIll' ACTIONFORH- FORM6 ADDRESS P.O. Box 599

Denver, CO 80201 .

ACfl0N CURRENT NEW API NUMBER WELLNAME WFli t0CATIOf SPUD ' EFFECTIVECODE ENTITYNO. ENTITYNO. QQ SC TP RG COUNTY DATE DATE

B î iñî 05>C5
43-047-3L1

73 Wonsits Va11ey Federal>121 NWSW
14 8S 21E Uintah 9/30/90

WELL1 COMMENTS: Ñc

WELL 2 COMHENTS

WELL 3 COMMENTS:
LN

WELL 4 COMMENTS:

MICROF

WELL5 COHMENTS:

ACTION CODES (See instructions on back of form)
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only)

. . . L. >B - Add new well to existing entity (group or unit well) ýgnatureC - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity Technical Asst.. ; 10/03/90D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity
E - Other (explain in comments section) Title 'Date

NOTE: Use COMMENTsection to explain why each Action Code was selected. Phone No. ( 303 ) 930-3691
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Form 3 5 UNITED STATES
FOR-9 maovso

ne., ' DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
gT,fg,2,"g~g

BUR.EAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5 une Dewanon ano senasso

U-0807
SUNORY NOTICES AND REPOATS ON WELLS it saan, wone, x 7,.,,,,

Do not use this form for proposals to drift or to deeoen or reentry to different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposata
If Grut or CA. Agreement Designauen

- SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE Wonsits Val ley

I. ry,o<wee
Federal

Od -- Gas O
8 Well Name ud No.

eu O Weti C Other

2. .sa..=, or oposor
121

Chevron U.S.A. Inc. Rm. 13097
'""°

3. Adams ama Te:=enone so
43-047-31873

P.0. Box 599, fienver CO 80701 (303) 930-169Î
10 Field and Poot or Exploratory Area

4 anon oc wou re-se. see.. T. a.. w . or so.-o >=scopoor- | Wonsits/Grn. River

Section 14, T8S, R21E
ucouaryorransa.suu

Uintah, UT

t2 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, AEPORT, CA OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACT10N

Noace of it:::::: Atandon:nent
C ge of Plus

Recor:-.panon .New Comoon

Su:-sequent Report Plugging Saca
Non-Ra Fmnag

Cas.::g Regg
Wamt Shudd

Fu·¾ Abancor.ment Nouce Cug
Comon m b,m

Ceer
ote. Re;mrt results of :nt:10pit complecon ott WeUComple::on :r

Recompleuon Report and Log fortit i

13 Descr.be Proposed er Compated Operaaons tClearly state all peronent:::aus. anc got per.l.nce.: dates. socio::.; esu:7.ated ¢.ate of stamng ar.yproposed wort lf well .s direc::orgy :::.«

give suesurface lo:auens and measured and trae semcal deptits for 18 tr.: re., and :: es peronent to P.:s work.?

WVFU121 was completed as follows:
1. MIRU GUDAC#1, 10/17/90. NU & tst B0PE.
2. RIH w/bit & csg scraper. P-test csg to 1000 psi. TOOHw/bit & scraper, PBTD @5378'.

3. Run CBL-VDL-GRfrom 5377 ' to 2200 '
.

4. Perf Gl from 5278-94 & 5289-5304 w/4" HSC gun. 4 JSPF, 90° phasing & 23 gram chgs.
5. Set pkr @ 5266'. Press tbg & perfs to 1400 psi, perfs broKe dn. Release pkr.

6. Acidize w/1000 gal 15°/oSWIC acid. Swab. POOHw/tbg, RINw/tbg, hydrotest to 4000 psi.

7. Set pkr @ 5172'. Frac G1 (5278-5304') w/Pregel YF-40. Swab.
8. R1ease pkr. Perf. F2 from 5175 to 5192 w/4" guns, 4 SPF, 90° phasing, 23 gram shots.

9. Set RBP @ 5218 & pkr @ 5115, P-test - pump into perfs.
10. Acidize perfs 5175-5192 w/500 gal SWIC acid. Swab.

3- TALM

11. Rilease pkr. Perf E-5, 5106-5114. w/4 SPF & 90° phasing. a 5+A‡€'

12. Set RBP @ 5i50 & prk @ 5138 test. Reset pkr @ 5023.
13. Acidize perfs 5106-5114 w/500 gas SWIC acid. Swab.
14. POOHw/RBP & pkr. RIH w/prod. String.

Sect 4 C'

15. RD 80PE. RU to runrods & pump. P-test. Seck

16. RD GUDAC#1 10/27/90. TWOTP.

14. I herstry car ty etu foretouts true uma com:ct

sign.e e, Environmental S Ciali¢:# Date

(Tks space for Federalor Sta a offica use)
Date

Approved
Condauons of approval, if any:

Title is U.S.C. Secoon1001, makas it a enme for any person knowingly and wtilt y to maan to any departmers or agercy of the Uruted Scaresany false. cunous or fr ens s are:-

or reo•ee-tanons as to sav rzarr within its



Form3160-4 Form approved.
(No.ember 1983) U ED STATES SUBMIT IN DUPL E. Budget Bureau No. 1004-0137

(formerly 9-330) (se er in- Expires August 31, 1985

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. IX.tSF I)ESONATION AND SERIK NO.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT U-0807

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETlON REPORT AND LOG* ""°'^" '"°""'°222,s.sas.

la. TYPE OF WELL: on. «.As ---

WELL WEI.L DRY (get * Ï. I'NIT AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF COMPLETION: Wonsits Valley Federal

2. NA31E OF OPERATOR Wonsits Vallev
Chevron U.S.A. Inc., Rm. 13097 -- - e. wree so.

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR

P.O. Box 599, Denver, CO 80201 (303) 930-3691 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

4. I,oCATION OF wsi.L (Report location clearly and in accordance icith any State requirementa)• Wonsits/Grn River
653' FWL, 2313' FSL (NW, SW) "· gyg2;R., M., OR BLOCK AND SURVEY

At top prod. Interval reported below

At total depa 653' FWL, 2313' FSL (NW, SW)
14-T8S-R21E

14. PER311T NO. DATE ISSCED 12. COUNTT OR 13. STATE
PARISH

43-047-31873 \ 8-2-90 Uintah Utah
15. DATE SPCDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 17. DATE COMPL. (Ready to prod.) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, GE, ETC.)s 19. ELEV. CASINGHEAD

9-30-90 10-9-90 I 10-27-90 \GL = 4855; RKB = 4871 | 4855
20. T&rAL DEPTH, MD & TVD 21. PLUG, BACK T.D., MD.& TVD 22. IF MI'LTIPI.E COMPL., 23. INTERVAf.S ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS

HOW MANT' DRILLED BY

MD= 5500 5408 a I X
4. PRODI CING INTERVAL(S). OF THIS CO311'LETION-TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND TVD)* 25. WAS DIRECTIONAL

(Gl) 5278-5304 (F2) 5175-5L92 (E5) 5106-5114
SURVEY MADE

No
26. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN 27. WAS WELL COKED

DIL-SFL; CNL-LDTw/Caliper (openhole) Microlog No
28. CASING RECORD (Report all strings set in teell)

CASING SIZE WEIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE CE5fENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED

16" 95' 20" Redi-Mix
9-5/8" 36 500.01' 125" Class H - 247sx
7" 26 & 23 5498.49 8-3/4"| Prem AG-250, 700 sx leads 270 sx tail

I I
29. LINER RECORD 30. TUBING RECORD

SIZE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT* SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

2-7/8" 5044.05 N/A

31. PzaroaATtoN ascoRD (Ínterval, Bize and numb€r) 32. ACID. SHOT. FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

5106-5114, . 5" 4 SPF DEPTH INTERVAL (MD) A.MOUNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL USED

5175-5192,
.5",

4. SPF 5278-5304 300 gal 15% HC1
5278-5304, 4" HSC gun, 4 SPF 5175-5192 500 gal 15% SWIC ACID

5106-5114 500 gal 15% SWIC ACID
5278-5304 I Frac-Pregel YF-40

33.* PRODFCTION

DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHoo (Flotoing, gas lift, pumping-size and type of pump) wsLL sTATus (Producing or
shut.in)

11/?/90 Pum2ing 1-3/4" three-tube Producing
DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SIZE PROD'N. FOR OIL--BBL. GAS--MCF. WATER--BBL. GAS-OIL RATIO

11/7/90 I 24
TEST PERIOD

33 46
FLOW. TUBING PRzss, PASING PREsscRE CALCULATED OIL--BBL. GAS--MCF. WATER--BBL. OIL GRAVITY-API (CORR.)

24-Houx RArz

50 3 33 46 30
34. DISPOSITION OF GAS (ßold, used for fu I, vented, €‡c.) TEST WITNESSED BT

Used for fuel I
35. LIST OF ATTACHMENTS

36. I bcereby certify h foregoin ttached information is complete a d correcet as deterS cdfrom aSllavailable records

*(SeeInstructionsand Spacesfer Additional Data on ReverseSide)
I'itle 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the
United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its



37. SUMMARY OF POROUS ZONES: (Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof; cored intervals; and all

drill-stem, tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures, and 38. GEOLOGIC MARKERS

recoveries):

FORMATK)N TOP BOTTOM DESCRIPTION,CONTENTS,ETC. TcsP

NAME
MEAS.DEPTH TRUE

No cores or DST's VERT.DEPTH

Green River 4630 4642 Water Uinta Fm. Surface

Green River 5104 5114 Oil Green River Fm. 2282

Green River 5174 5183 Oil ES Sand 5104

Green River 5280 5284 Oil F2 Sand 5174
Green River 5287 5294 Oil F4 Sand 5229

Gl Lime 5278
G2 Sand



F°2'3'6° 6 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(June 1990) DE . NT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Expires: March31, 1993

5. Lease Designation and SerialNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-0807

Do not use this formfor proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir

Use "APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT--" for such proposals 0. If fndim AUotteeor Tribe Name

N/A

SUBMIT IN TMPLICA TE 7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

1. Type of Well Wonsits Valley Federal Unit

Oil Gas

Well Weu Other 8. Well Name and No.

Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 121

2. NameofOperator

CHEVRON U.S.A. PRODUCTION COMPANY 9. APÏ Wen No.

3 Address and Telephone No. Steve McPherson in Red Wash (801) 781-4310 43-047-31873

11002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 or Gary Scott in Rangely, CO. (970) 675-3791 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well(Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) Wonsits Valley - Green River

ll. CountyorParish,State

2313' FSL & 653' FWL (NW SW) SECTION 14, TSS, R21E, SLBM UINTAH, UTAH

12 CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, R OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O No om nt Abandonment Change of Plans

Recompletion New Codo

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

O Casing Repá WM Rut-O

FinalAbandonment Notice Alty Cong Cmwo o

O °-' O
(Note) Report results of multiple completion on Well
Comÿletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state allpertinent details, and givepertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If wellis directionally drilled,

give subsurface locations and measured and true verticaldepths for allmarkers and zones pertinent to this work)

DATE OF WORK 1/11/96 THRU 1/24/96

SQUEEZED PERFS 5106-5614 AND 5175-5192 WITH 150 SXS CLASS H CEMENT
ACIDIZED PERFS 5278-5304 WITH 5000 GALLONS 28% HCL

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
signedG.D. SCOTT Title DRILLING TECHNICIAN Date January 26, 1996

is space for Federal or State oflice use)

Approved by: Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowinglyand willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the IJnitedStates any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or

representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

*See instruction on Reverse



Fom13160-5
UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

ounei"°> DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March31, 1993

5 Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-0807
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals 6 If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICA TE ' 'f ""I'°r cA, Agreement oesignation
1. Type of Well

Wonsits Valley Federal Unit
Oil Gas

Well Wen Other 8. Well Name and No.

Wonsits ValleyFederalUnit121
2. Name of Operator

CHEVRON U.S.A. PRODUCTION COMPANY 9. API WellNo.
3 Address and Telephone No

43-047-31873
11002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 (801) 781. 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4300

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) Wonsits Valley - Green River
l l. County or Parish, State

2313' FSL&653' FWL(NWSW)SECTION14,TSS,R21E,SLBM UINTAH, UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans

New Construction

Subsequent Report PluggingBack Non-Routine Fracturing

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Cma to on

Other ELIMINATE WATER Dispose water

(Note) Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log fomt)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, includingestimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionallydrilled,give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)

THE FOLLOWING WORK WAS DONE FROM 9/7/99 TO 9/22/99:

1. CLEAN OUT TO 5386'
2. CEMENT SQUEEZE PERFS: 5106'-14' WITH 2 SQUEEZE JOBS. A TOTAL OF 135 SX CLASS G CEMENT
3. DRILL OUT CEMENT
4. EQUIP TO PUMP

0CT 2 8 1999

DIVOFDiL,GAS&MEG

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is tru d co
Signed D. C. BEAMAN Titi COMPUTER SYSTEMS OPERATOR Date 10/26/1999

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Approved by: Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United Statesany false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See instruction on Reverse



Form3|as UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
A""*l"°) ARTMENT OF THE lNTERIOR Budgel BureauNo. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen pr reentry to a different reservoir

Use "APPLICATION FOR ÉERMIT-" for such proposals 5. Iffndian, AllotteeorTribeName

N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICA TE' 7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

1. TypeofWell Wonsits Valley Federal Unit
Oil Gas 14-08-001-8482
Well Well Other MULTIPLEWELLSSEEATTACHEDLIST S.WelINameandNo.

2 NameofOperator

CHEVRON U.S.A. INC. 9. API Well No.

3 Address and Telephone No.

I1002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 (801) 781-430 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4 Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R , M., or Survey Description) Wonsits Valley - Green River
i 1. County or Parish, State

UINTAH, UTAII

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans

Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair W ter Rut OŒ

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection

Other CIIANGE OF OPERATOR Dispose Water

(Note) Report results of muhiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Repon and Log form )

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all peninent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work If well is directionally drilled,give subsurface locations and measured and tme vertical depths for al markers and zones pertinent to this work)

As of January 1, 2000 Chevron U.S.A. Inc. resigns as Operator of the Wonsits Valley Unit.
The Unit number is 14-08-001-8482 effective November 23, 1962.

The successor operator under the Unit Agreement will be
Shenandoah Energy Inc.
475 17th Street, Suite 1000
Denver, CO 80202

Agreed and accepted to this 29th day of December, 1999 RECE IVED
Shenando h

OEC3 0 1999
Mitchel L. Solich

DIVISIONOFOlL,GAS&MINING
President

14. I hereby cellify that the foregoing is mie and correct
Signed A. E. Wacker § .

Title Assistant Secretary Date 12/29/99

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Approved by: Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fielitious or fraudulent statements or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See instruction on Reverse



O O
United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEME= RECElVED
Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155 FEBO7 2000

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
DIVISiON OF

OIL,GAS AND MINING
IN REPLY REFER TO

UT-931
February 4, 2000

Shenandoah Energy Inc.
Attn: Rae Cusimano
475 17thStreet, Suite 1000
Denver, Colorado 80202

Re: Wonsits Valley Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

On December 30, 1999, we received an indenture whereby Chevron U.S.A. Inc. resigned as Unit
Operator and Shenandoah Energy Inc. was designated as Successor UnitOperator for the
Wonsits Valley Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effective February 4,
2000. In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the
designated party has obtained allrequired approval that would entitle it to conduct operations
under the Wonsits Valley UnitAgreement.

Your statewide (Utah) oil and gas bond No. 0969 willbe used to cover all operations within the
Wonsits Valley Unit.

It is requested that you notifyall interested parties of the change in unit operator. Copies of the
approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriate federal offices, with one copy
returned herewith.

Sincerely,

Is/ Robert A. Henricks

Robert A. Henricks
Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure

cc: Chevron U.S.A. Inc.

bcc: Field Manager - Vernal (wlenclosure)
bivisionof Oil, Gaá MiÑAg'

Minerals Adjudication Group U-932
File - Wonsits Valley Unit(wlenclosure)
MMS - Data Management Division
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron



Well Lease i API Number . Status Type
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 9 U-0806 43-047-15440 TA INJ :
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 16 U-0807 43-047-15447 A ilNJ 1
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 21 ML-2237 43-047-15452 A INJ 1
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 28-2 U-0806 43-047-31524 A INJ
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 31 U-0807 43-047-15460 A INJ
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 32 ML-2237 43-047-16513 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 35 U-0807 43-047-15463 A INJ
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 36 U-0806 43-047-15464 A INJ
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 40-2 U-0806 43-047-31798 A INJ
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 41 U-0807 43-047-15469 A INJ
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 43 U-0806 43-047-15471 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 48 U-0806 43-047-15476 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 50 U-0807 43-047-15477 A INJ
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 53 U-0806 43-047-20003 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 55 U-0807 43-047-20005 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 59 U-0807 43-047-20018 A INJ
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 62 U-0806 43-047-20024 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit '65 U-0807 43-047-20041 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 67 U-0807 43-047-20043 A INJ
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 68 U-0807 43-047-20047 A INJ
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 71-2 U-0807 43-047-32449 _ A INJ
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 72 ML-2237A 43-047-20058 A INJ
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 73 ML-2237 43-047-20066 A INJ
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 74 ML-2237 43-047-20078 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 75 ML-2237 43-047-20085 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit .78

ML-2237 43-047-20115 A INJ
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 97 U-0806 43-047-30014 iA INJ I
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 103 U-0807 43-047-30021 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 104 U-0807 43-047-30022 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 105 U-0806 43-047-30023 A ¡OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit109 U-0807 43-047-30045 A lOIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 110 U-0807 43-047-30046 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 112 U-0807 43-047-30048 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 119 U-0804 43-047-32461 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 120 U-0804 43-047-32462 A INJO Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 121 U-0807 43-047-31873 A OIL

onsits Valley Federal Unit 124 U-0807 43-047-30745 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 126 U-0804 43-047-30796 A INJ
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 127 STATE 43-047-31611 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 128 U-0806 43-047-30798 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 130 U-0804 43-047-32307 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 132 U-0807 43-047-30822 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 133 U-0807 43-047-31706 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 134 ML-2237 43-047-31118 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 135-2 U-0804 43-047-32016 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 136 U-0804 43-047-31047 A _ OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 137 U-0806 43-047-31523 A OIL
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 140 U-0807 43-047-31707 A INJ
Wonsits Valley Federal Unit 141 ML-2237 43-047-31609 A OIL

Page



DIvisionof Oil, Gas and Mining
IICPUTIT40; y

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH y 4-KA
,

2. CDWA 515 y

3.JLT 6'-FILE
Enter date after each listed item is completed

X Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent

Operator Name Change (Only) Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 01/01/2000

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
CHEVRON USA INC SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC
riddress:11002 E.17500 S. 24ddress:11002 E.17500 S.
VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 VERNAL, UT 84078

Phone:1-(435)-781-4300 Phone:1-(435)-781-4300

Account No. NO210 Account No. N4235

CA No. Unit: WONSITS VALLEY

WELL(S)
NAME API ENTITY SECTION TOWNSHIP RANGE LEASE
TV3CFU48 43-047-15476 5265 10 08S 21E FEITEFutL
VVVFU53 43-047-20003 5265 10 08S 21E FEITEFLAL
VVi37D62 43-047-20024 5265 10 08S 21E FEDEFLAL
VVVFU 105 43-047-30023 5265 10 08S 21E FEITEFutL
VV\]TU 128 43-047-30798 5265 10 08S 21E FEJÏEFLAL
NV\fFLI43 43-047-15471 5265 11 08S 21E FEDEFLAL
VVVFTJ55 43-047-20005 5265 14 08S 21E FEITEFLAL
VViTTU103 43-047-30021 5265 14 08S 21E FEITEFutL
TVVFU 110 43-047-30046 5265 14 08S 21E FEITEFLAL
NViTTU121 43-047-31873 5265 14 08S 21E FEIÏEFukL
TV\STD65 43-047-20041 5265 15 08S 21E FEIÏEFLAL
TVVFU 104 43-047-30022 5265 15 08S 21E FEIÏEFukL
TVi97D 109 43-047-30045 5265 15 08S 21E FEIÏEFukL
VV\lID 112 43-047-30048 5265 15 08S 21E FEIÏEFukL
WVFU 124 43-047-30745 5265 15 08S 21E FEDERAL
VV\lIU 132 43-047-30822 5265 15 08S 21E FERIEFDAL
VVVFU 133 43-047-31706 5265 15 08S 21E FEDEILAL
TVVVD 119 43-047-32461 5265 21 08S 21E FEIÏEFLAL
VV\lID 135-2 43-047-32016 5265 21 08S 21E FEITEFukL
VV\TTU136 43-047-31047 5265 21 08S 21E FE11ERakL
VVVFU 130 43-047-32307 5265 22 08S 21E FEI)EFukL

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 12/30/1999

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 08/09/2000

3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on:



4. Is the new operator registered in the Stat Utah: YES Business Number: 224885

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: 02/04/2000

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator
for wells listed on: 02/04/2000

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC" The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,

for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 08/22/2000

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 08/22/2000

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: N/A

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: N/A

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed has furnished a bond: N/A

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on:

FILMING:
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on: 5 Û)

FILING:
1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:



09
9) ITED STATES FORM APPROVED

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Ex rs
NNo r1n0b0e300,325000

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UO807

Do not use this form for proposals to dri/I or to re-enter an
abandoned we/I. Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side. 89U1nt08r4C OAgreement,Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.

Oil Well O Gas Well O Other
WVFU 121

2. Name of Operator Contact: ANN PETRIK 9. API Well No.
SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC. E-Mail:ann.petrik@questar.com 43-047-31873

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH Ph: 435.781.4306 WONSITS VALLEY
VERNAL, UT 84078 Fx: 435.781.4329

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, and State

Sec 14 T8S R21E NWSW 2313FSL 653FWL UINTAHCOUNTY, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Acidize O Deepen O Production (Start/Resume) 0 Water shut-Off
gNotice of Intent

O Alter Casing 0 Fracture Treat 0 Reclamation O Well Integrity
B Subsequent Report O Casing Repair O New Construction O Recomplete O Other

0 Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon E Temporarily Abandon

0 convertto Injection 0 Plug Back O Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

WE REQUEST A TA STATUS APPROVAL FOR THIS WELL.

WE BELIEVE A RETURN TO PRODUCTION COULD BE JUSTIFIED IN THE FUTURE.

RECElVED

E OIL, GAS AND MINING
ACITPTED BY: etober 1L 2002

Utah Division of OiL Gas and Mining

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Electronic Submission #14520 verifie i by the BLMWell Information System

For SHENANDOAH ENERUY INC., sent to the Vernal

e(Printed/ N PETRIK Title ADMINISTRATIVE CONTACT

Sig tury (Electronic Submission) Date 09/24/2002

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

ApprovegBy Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Office

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL** O ** ORIGINAL



O
st 9 9) UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Expires: November 30, 2000

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTUO807

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an
abandoned we/I. Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement,Name and/or No.
8910084820

1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.

Oil Well O Gas Well O Other
WVFU 121

2. NameofOperator Contact: ANN PETRIK 9. APIWellNo.
SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC. E-Mail:ann.petrik@questar.com 43-047-31873

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH Ph: 435.781.4306 WONSITS VALLEY
VERNAL,UT 84078 Fx: 435.781.4329

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) I l. County or Parish, and State

Sec 14 T8S R21E NWSW 2313FSL 653FWL UINTAHCOUNTY, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Acidize O Deepen B Production (Start/Resume) O Water Shut-Off
O Notice of Intent

O Alter Casing 0 Fracture Treat 0 Reclamation 0 Well Integrity

B Subsequent Report O Casing Repair 0 New Construction 0 Recomplete O Other

O Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon 0 Temporarily Abandon

0 Convert to Injection 0 Plug Back O Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinentmarkers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the BondNo. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

RETURN TO PRODUCTION ON 12/01/02.

RECEIVED

JAN2 8 2003
DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MIN\NG

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Electronic Submission #17949 verifie i by the BLMWell Information System

For SHENANDOAH ENEREY INC., sent to the Vernal

Name(Printyd7F ped) A TRIK Title ADMINISTRATIVECONTACT

b Signatu (Electr ic Submission) \ Date 01/23/2003

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved By Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Office

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORI L ** ORIGINAL



duction Company

1050 17th Street, Suite 500

Denver, CO 80265

Tel 303 672 6900 • Fax 303 294 9632

Denver Division

May 28, 2003

Division of Oil, Gas, & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P. O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Attention: JohnBaza/JimThompson

Gentlemen:

This will serve as notice that through the internal corporate changes described below,
activities formerly conducted in the name of either Shenandoah Operating Company, LLC
(SOC) and/or Shenandoah Energy, Inc. (SEI) will hereafter be conducted in the name of
QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.: i) the Shenandoah entities were purchased in July,2001 by Questar
Market Resources, Inc., which is a mid-level holding company for the non-utility businesses
of QuestarCorporation, ii) Shenandoah Operating Company, LLC has now been merged
into Shenandoah Energy, Inc. (SEI), iii) Shenandoah Energy, Inc. has now been re-named
QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. pursuant to a State of Delaware Amended and Restated Certiñcate
of Incorporation, iv) the same employees will continue to be responsible for operations of
the former SOC and SEI properties, both in the field and in the office. Accordingly, the
change involves only an intemal corporate name change and no third party change of
operator is involved. Please alter your records to reflect the entity name change. Attached is
a spreadsheet listing all wells affected by this change.

Should you have any questions, please call me at 303 - 308-3056.

Yours truly,

rank Nielsen
Division Landman

Enclosure RECE IVED
JUN0 2 2003

Div oF DIL,GAS &



O ONTOR

United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

NCH 3 Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
UT-922

June 9, 2003

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
1050 17thStreet, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265

Re: Wonsits Valley Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

On May 30, 2003, we received an indenture dated February 1, 2003, whereby Shenandoah Energy,
Inc. changed it name and QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. was designated as Successor UnitOperator for the
Wonsits Valley Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effective June 9, 2003.
In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the
designated party has obtained all required approval that would entitle it to conduct operations under
Wonsits Valley Unit Agreement.

Your nationwide (Eastern States) oiland gas bond No. BOOOÚ24willbe used to cover all operations
within the Wonsits Valley Unit.

It is requested that you notify all interested parties of the name change of unit operator. Copies of
the approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriate federal offices, with one copy
returned herewith.

Sincerely,

/s/ Robert A. Henricks

Robert A. Henricks
Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure
bcc: Field Manager - Vernal (wlenclosure)

SITLA
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
Minerals Adjudication Group
File - Wonsits Valley Unit (wlenclosure)
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron



O O

JUL 0 7 2003
3104 (932.34)WF
Nationwide Bond ESBOOOO24

NOTICE

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. : Oil and Gas
1050 17* Street Suite 500 : lease
Denver, Colorado 80265 :

Name Change Recognized

Acceptable evidence has been filed in this office concerning the name change of Shenandoah
Energy Incorporated into QEP Uinta Basin, Incorporated. QEP Uinta Basin, Incorporated is the
surviving entity. This name change is recognized effective April 17, 2003.

Eastern States will notify the Minerals Management Service and all applicable Bureau of Land
Management offices of the change by a copy of this notice.

If you identify other leases in which the merging entity maintain an interest, please contact this
office and we will appropriately document those files with a copy of this notice.

If you have any questions, please contact Bill Forbes at 703-440-1536.

Wilbert B. Forbes
Land Law Examiner

Branch of Use Authorization
Division of Resources Planning,

Use and Protection

bc: JFO,MMS, ES RF, 930 RF, 932.34 RF, E-932: wbf:07 /07/03:440-1536/ QEP Unita



SEI (N4235) to QEP (N2460) WONSITS VALLEYUNIT

well_name Sec T R api |Entity D:aseType type stat |unitname field county type lease # bond #
Y/VU 16 15 080S 210E 4304715447 5265 Ëederal VVI A VVONSETS99tLLEY 710 S UINOLAH I U-0807 UT-0969
WVU 21 16 080S 210E 4304715452 99990 State Wl A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
YVVU31 14 080S 210E 4304715460 5265 Federal VVI A VVO‡4SIfSVUMLLEY 710 S UlblitH l U-0807 UT-0969
Y/VU 35 14 080S 210E 4304715463 5265 Federal YVI A YVONSEESNULLLEY 710 S UlNTLAH l U-0807 UT-0969
M'VU 36 10 :080S 210E 4304715464 5265 Federed YVI A VVO‡9SITSNUMLLEY 710 S UINOPAH 1 U-0806 UT-0969
WVU 41 15 080S 210E 4304715469 5265 Federal WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 0-0807 UT-0969
WVU 43 _ ll 080S 210E 4304715471 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVU 48 10 080S 210E 4304715476 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0806 UT-0969
WVU 50 15 080S 210E 4304715477 5265 Federal WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
WVU 32 16 080S 210E 4304716513 5265 Stãte OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WVU 53 10 080S 210E 4304720003 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0806 UT-0969
YVVU55 14 080S 210E 4304720005 5265 Federed O\V P YVONSEES45tLLEY 710 S UIhnOAH l U-0807 UT-0969

VU 59 14 080S 210E 4304720018 5265 Federal WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
VU60 15 080S 210E 4304720019 5265 Federal wil A n'ONSVTSVALLEY 710 S UIhnOAH l U-0807 UT-0969

J 62 10 080S 210E 4304720024 5265 Federed CAV P VVO¢4SFESNUMLLEY 710 S UINTLAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WW65 15 080S 210E 4304720041 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
M'VU67 15 080S 210E 4304720043 5265 Federal VVI A VVCfúSYTSVLALLEY 710 S UlbrfAH l U-0807 UT-0969
\VN1J68 15 080S 210E 4304720047 5265 Federal MII A YVONSYTSVALLEY 710 S U1NTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
\VVU 72 16 080S 210E 4304720058 99990 State VVI A VVONSETSVALLEY 710 S UlbllAH 3 FAL-2237A 159261960rÑŸÜ73 16 080S 210E 4304720066 5265 State WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WVU 74 16 080S 210E 4304720078 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
W_VU75 16 080S .210E 4304720085 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WVU 78 16 080S 210E 4304720115 99990 State WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960

ŸÏÏ83 23 080S 210E 4304720205 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0809 UT-0969
VU 97 11 080S 210E 4304730014 5265 Federal VVI A VVO‡4SffSVALLEY 710 S UINDEAH 1 U-0806 UT-0969

03 14 080S 210E 4304730021 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
04 _ l_5 080S 210E 4304730022 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969

WVU 105 10 080S 210E 4304730023 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVU 109 15 080S 210E 4304730045 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0807 UT-0969

14 080S 210E 4304730046 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
U 15 080S 210E 4304730048 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969

VU 124 15 080S 210E 4304730745 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806
WVU 126 21 080S 210E 4304730796 5265 Federal WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0804 UT-0969

10 080S 210E 4304730798 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVU 132 15 080S 210E 4304730822 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0807 UT-0969
WVU 136 21 080S 210E 4304731047 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0804 UT-0969
WVU 134 16 080S 210E |4304731118 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
VVV1J137 ll 080S 210E 4304731523 5265 Federal CAV P VVCRNSETSVALLEY 710 S UINODAH 1 U-0806 UT-0969
VVVU28-2 11 080S 210E 4304731524 99990 Federal YVI A VVONSEESVrMLLEY 710 S UlbnOAH 1 U-0806 UT-0969
VVVU141 16 080S 210E 4304731609 5265 State CAV P VVCfdSffSVrMLLEY 710 S UINTLAH 3 FAL-2237 159261960
WVU 127 16 080S 210E 4304731611 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
V/klJ 142 16 080S 210E 4304731612 5265 State CAV P VVCURSITSVALLEY 710 S UINGLAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
V/Lij 133 15 080S 210E 4304731706 5265 Federal OAV P VVONSITSVALLEY 710 S UIFTTAJá 1 U-0807 UT-0969
WVU 140 15 080S 210E 4304731707 5265 Federal WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
W U 40-2 10 080S 210E 4304731798 5265 Federal WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0806 UT-0969

o&gdbsorted 1
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WVU 144 10 080S 210E 4304731807 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0806 UT-0969
WVU 143 10 080S 210E 4304731808 5265 Federal WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0806 UT-0969

U 145 18 080S 220E 4304731820 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-057 UT-0969
WVU 121 14 080S 210E 4304731873 5265 Federal OW S WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0807 UT-0969
WVU 135-2 21 080S 210E 4304732016 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0804 UT-0969
WVU 130 22 080S 210E 4304732307 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0804 UT-0969
WVU 71-2 15 080S 210E 4304732449 5265 Federal WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU l 19 21 080S 210E 4304732461 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH \ U-0804 UT-0969
WVFU 120 22 080S 210E 4304732462 5265 Federal WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-0804 UT-0969

FU 54 WG 07 080S 220E 4304732821 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-22158 UT-0969
WVFU 69 WG 18 080S 220E 4304732829 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-057 UT-0969

VFU 38 WG 08 080S 220E 4304732831 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-022158 UT-0969
VFU 49 WG 08

080Š¯i20E
4304732832 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-022158 UT-0969

VFU 138 WG 18 080S 220E 4304733054 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-057 UT-0969
WVFU 14 WG 12 080S 210E 4304733070 12436 Federal GW P WONSlTS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-806 UT-0969
WVFU 11 WG 12 080S 210E 4304733085 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 81 WG 24 080S 210E 4304733086 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0810 UT-0969

\WVFU 146 WG 19 080S 220E 4304733128 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 630 S UINTAH l U-057 UT-0969
Vf_U W-l 8- 14 080S 210E 4304733220 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969

WVFU 5W-13-_g21 13 080S 210E 4304733221 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 9W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733223 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-3084A 159261960
WVFU 46 WG 07 080S 220E 4304733241 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-022158 UT-0969
WVFU 2W-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304733246 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WVFU 2G-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304733247 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960

|WVFU 9W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733269 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
WVFtf 7W-13-8-'il 13 080S 210E 4304733270 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAE 1 U-0806 UT-0969

VÌU 15 55-22 18 080S 220E 4304733294 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-057 UT-0969
wviinW-Tää2 08 080S 220E 4304733295 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-022158 UT-0969
WVFU 3W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733493 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-022158 UT-0969

VFU 5W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733494 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-022158 UT-0969
VFU 11W-7g-22 07 080S 220E 4304733495 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-022158 UT-0969
VFU 13W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733496 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-022158 UT-0969

WVFU lW-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 430473350\ 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-022158 UT-0969
WVFU 3W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733502 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAE 1 U-022158 UT-0969
WV 7WRG-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733503 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I UTU-02215 UT-0969
WVFU 6W-l6-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304733527 12436 State GW P C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WVFU 16W-9-8-21 09 080S 210E 4304733529 12436 Federal GW P WONSlTS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-0805 UT-0969
WVFU IW-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733531 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU lW-l3-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733532 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S U1NTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 3W-18-8-22 18

080S¯220E
4304733533 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-057 UT-0969

\ŸVFU 9W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733534 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU llW-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733535 12436 Federal GW P WONSITSVALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU llW-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733536 12436 Federal GW P WONSITSVALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 13W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733537 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 13W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733538 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-057 UT-0969

o&g db sorted 2



SEl (N4235) to QEP (N2460) WONSITS VALLEYUNIT
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WVFU 6G-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304733564 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WVFU 16G-9-8-21 09 080S 210E 4304733565 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l U-0805 UT-0969
WVFU Ñ-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733602 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-68217 UT-0969
WVFU 3W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733603 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 3W-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304733604 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0804 UT-0969
WVFU 3W-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304733605 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0810 UT-0969
WVFU 13W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733606 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 13W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733607 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 15W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733608 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU lW-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304733613 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0810 UT-0969
WVFU 11W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733626 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l U-057 UT-0969

I

VFU 16W-2-8-21 02 080S 210E 4304733645 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 10
S¯UINTAH

3 ML-2785 159261960
VFU 9W-2-8-21 02 080S 210E 4304733648 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 2 S UINTAH 3 ML-2785 159261960
VFU 12W-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304733649 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960

WVFU 12G-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304733650 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S
¯ÜÏNTAH

3 ML-2237 159261960
WVFU 2W-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304733655 12436 Federal GW P WONSlTS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 4W-! 1-8-21 11 080S |210E 4304733657 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 12W-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304733659 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY flÏ)Š UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 12G-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304733660 5265 Federal OW P WONSlTS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 15W-9-8-21 09 080S 210E 4304733661 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0805 UT-0969
WVFU 15G-9-8-2] 09 080S 210E 4304733662 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0805 UT-0969
WVFU 2W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733791 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 6W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733792 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU SW-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733793 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 10W-1-8-21 01 080S 210E 4304733794 12436 Federal GW S WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0802 UT-0969
WVFU 10W-l3-8-'l 13 080S 210E 4304733795 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH 1 U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 16W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733796 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-3084 159261960
WVFU 12W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733808 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-022158 UT-0969
WVFU 6W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733811 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-022158 UT-0969

VFU 7W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733812 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-022158 UT-0969
VFU 10W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733813 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-022158 UT-0969

WVFU 10W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733814 13450 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-022158 UT-0969
WVFU 12W-8-8-22 08 080S 220Ë 4304733815 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l U-022158 UT-0969
WVFU 14W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733816 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH 1 0-022158 UT-0969
Wig1 -8-2 07 080S 220E 4304733817 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-022158 UT-0969
WVFU 6W-7-g22 07 080S 220E 4304733828 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-022158 UT-0969
WVFU 6W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733842 12436 Federal GW P C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-057 UT-0969
WVFUjWC-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733843 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH 1 U-057 UT-0969
WVFU 6WD-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733844 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-057 UT-0969
WVFU 5W-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304733860 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY . 710 S UINTAH \ U-0809 UT-0969
WVFU 7W-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304733861 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0809 UT-0969
WVFU 8W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733862 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 10W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733863 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 14W-12-8-2] 12 080S 210E 4304733864 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU I6W-l2-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733865 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969

o&gdb sorted 3
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WVFU l W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304733902

'
12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969

WVFU l W-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304733903 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-06304 UT-0969
WVFU lW-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304733904 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0809 UT-0969
WVFU 6W-l1-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304733906 12436 Fedeial GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WV 7W-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304733907 13230 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0804 UT-0969
VÏŸÈU7W-2ÃÀ-21 24 080S 210E 4304733908 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0810 UT-0969
WVFU 10W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304733910 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU l lW-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304733911 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 11W-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304733912 13228 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 2 S UINTAH l UTU-68219 UT-0969
WVFU 13W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304733913 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WŸËÜ13W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304733914 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0807 UT-0969

VFU 15W-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304733916 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
VFU 15W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304733917 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0807 UT-0969
VFU 5W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733953 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969

WVFU 7W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733955 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 8W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304733957 12436 Federal |GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 8W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733958 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 9W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304733959 12436 Federal IGW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 12W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733961 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 14W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733962 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY _ 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 15W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733963 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 2W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733986 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-057 UT-0969
WV 8W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733989 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-9617 UT-0969
WVFU 10W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733991 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-057 UT-0969
WVFU 12W-18-8-22 18 080S |220E 4304733993 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH 1 U-057 UT-0969
WV 14W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733995 12436lFederal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-057 UT-0969
WVFU 6W-1-8-21 01 080S 210E 4304734008 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0802 UT-0969
WVFU 8W-1-8-21 01 080S 210E 4304734009 12436 Federal GW DRL C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0802 UT-0969
WV 10G-2-8-21 02 080S 210E 4304734035 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 2 S UINTAH 3 ML-2785 159261960

i V 14G-2-8-21 02 080S 210E 4304734036 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2785 159261960
VTW-l7-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734038 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-055 UT-0969
V 16W-1-8-21 Ol 080S 210E 4304734047 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH Ï U-0802 UT-0969

WV 13G-2-8-21 02 080S 210E 4304734068 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2785-A 159261960
WV 5G-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734107 5265|State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WV 12G-1-8-21 01 080S 210E 4304734108 5265|Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0802 UT-0969
WV 2W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734140 12436'Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I UTU-0807 U-0969
GH 2W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734141 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0804 U-0969
WV 2W-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304734142 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0809 U-0969
GH 3W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734143 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0804 U-0969
WV 4W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304734144 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
GH 4W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734145 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-0804 UT-0969
WV 4W-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304734146 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0804 U-0969
WV 16W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304734155 12436 Federal GW S WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 3W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734187 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 630 S UINTAH l UTU-057 UT-0969
WV 4W-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304734188 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-809 UT-0969

o&g db sorted 4
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WV 6W-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304734189 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-809 UT-0969
WV 1IW-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734190 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WV 13W-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734191 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237A 159261960
WV 14W-l6-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734192 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WV 15W-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734224 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WV 16W-16g-21 16 080S 210E 4304734225 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237A 159261960
WV 2W-15-8-21 15 0808 210E 4304734242 12436 Federal GW P WONSlTS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0807 UT-0969
WV 2W-22-8-21

_22 080S 210E 4304734243 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-0804 UT-0969
WV 4W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734244 lŽ436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
WV 6W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304734245 12436 Federal . GW TA WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WV 7W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734246 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969

V 8W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734247 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0807 UT-0969
V 12W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304734248 12436 Federal GW TA WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
V 14W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734249 12436 Federal ' GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-0807 UT-0969

WV 16W-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304734250 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 16W-l5-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734251 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-0807 UT-0969
WV \ W-l l-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304734263 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 2W-11-8-21 l_l 080S 210E 4304734264 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 2W-12-8-21 12 .080S 210E 4304734265 12436 Federal GW DRL C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH \ UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 3W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304734266 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 3W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304734267 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 4W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304734268 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 5W-11-8-21 ll 080S 210E 4304734269 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 5W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304734270 12436 Federal GW DRL C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 6W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 430473427\ 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-0807 UT-0969
WV 9W-!1-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304734274 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV gg 8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734275 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0807 UT-0969
WV 11W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304734276 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 7IO S UINTAH 1 UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV l lW-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734277 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0807 UT-0969

i V 12W-!1-8-21 ll 080S 210E 4304734278 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
V 12W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734279 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0807 UT-0969

WV 14W-l l-8-21 11 0808 210E 4304734280 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 14W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734281 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0807 UT-0969
WV 15W-I1-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304734282 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 16W-14-8-2l 14 080S 210E 4304734283 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0807 UT-0969
WV lW-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734288 State GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WV 3W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734289 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0807 UT-0969
WV 3W-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734290 State GW APD C WONSlTS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WV 4W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734291 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0807 UT-0969
WV 4W-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734292 State GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WV 5W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734293 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-0807 UT-0969'Ã' W 5-8JI 15 080S 210E 4304734294 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-0807 UT-0969
WV 10W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734295 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0807 UT-0969
WVU 5W-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734321 12436 State GW DRL WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH 3 ML-2237 04127294
WV 7W-16-8-2l 16 080S 210E 4304734322 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960

o&g db sorted 5



. SEI (N4235) to QEP (N2460) WONSITS VALLEYUNIT

well_name See T R api Entity lease Type type stat |unitname field county type lease # bond #
WV 8W-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734323 State GW APD WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WV 9W-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734325 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WV 10W-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734326 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WVU 4W-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304734330 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0810 U-0969
WVU 2W-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304734337 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0810 UT-0969
WVU 6W-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304734338 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-08l0 UT-0969
WVU 8W-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304734339 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-0809 UT-0969
WVU 8W-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304734340 12436 Federal GW P C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0810 UT-0969
WV 2G-7-8-22 07 080S

_

220E 4304734355 Federal OW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-02215 UT-0969
WV 2W-7-8-22 07 080S

_

220E 4304734356 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-02215 UT-0969
WV 4G-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734357 Federal OW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-022l5 UT-0969
WV 4WA-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304734358 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-057 UT-0969

8 WV 4WD-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304734359 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-057 UT-0969
WV 13WA-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304734361 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-057 UT-0969
WV 13WD-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304734362 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-057 UT-0969
WV 2WA-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304734426 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-057 UT-0969
WV 2WD-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304734427 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY _ 710 S UINTAH l UTU-057 UT-0969
WV 3WA-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304734428 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-057 UT-0969
WV 3WD-18-8-22

18¯
080S 220E 4304734429 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-057 UT-0969

WV 4W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734457 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-02215 UT-0969
WV lW-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734467 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-02215 UT-0969
WV 2W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734468 12436 Federal GW P C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-02215 UT-0969
WV BW-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304734469 12436 Federal GW DRL C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-02215 UT-0969
WV 8W-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304734564 12436 Federal GW P C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-0804 U-0969
WV 3G-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734596 5265 Federal OW TA C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S DINTAH l 0-022158 U-0969
WONSITS VALLEY 1G-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304734597 Federal OW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-022l58 U-0969
WONSITS VALLEY 5G-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734612 Federal OW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-02215 U-0969
WONSITS VALLEY 7G-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734613 Federal OW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-76508 U-0969
WV I IG-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734614 Federal OW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I UTU-02215 U-0969
WV 13G-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734615 Federal OW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-02215 U-0969O VV 15G-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304734626 Federal OW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-02215 U-0969
WV 11G-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304734627 Federal OW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-02215 U-0969
WONSITS VALLEY 7G-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304734628 Federal OW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-02215 U-0969
WONSITS VALLEY 9G-7-8-22 07 0805 220E 4304734629 Federal OW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-02215 U-0969
WV EXT 2W-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304734928 12436 Federal GW DRL C WONSITS VALLEY 610 S UINTAH 1 UTU-68219 UT-1237

o&gdb sorted 6



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET |1.GLH

(2. CDW
|3.FILE

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent/Operator

X Operator Name Change Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 2/1/2003
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N4235-Shenandoah Energy Inc N2460-QEP Uinta Basin Inc

11002E 17500S 11002E 17500S
Vernal, UT 84078-8526 Vernal, UT 84078-8526

Phone: (435) 781-4341 Phone: (435) 781-4341

CA No. Unit: WONSITS VALLEY UNIT
WELL(S)
NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL Confid

NO TYPE TYPE STATUS

WVU 144 10 080S 210E 4304731807 5265 Federal OW P
WVU 137 11 080S 210E 4304731523 5265 Federal OW P
WVFU 14 WG 12 080S 210E 4304733070 12436 Federal GW P -

WVFU 11 WG 12 080S 210E 4304733085 12436 Federal GW P
WVU 121 14 080S 210E 4304731873 5265 Federal OW S
WVU 133 15 080S 210E 4304731706 5265 Federal OW P
WVU 134 16 080S 210E 4304731118 5265 State OW P
WVU 141 16 080S 210E 4304731609 5265 State OW P
WVU l27 16 080S 210E 4304731611 5263 State OW P
WVU 142 16 080S 210E 4304731612 5265 State OW P
WVU 135-2 21 080S 210E 4304732016 5265 Federal OW P
WVFU l 19 21 0808 210E 4304732461 5265 Federal OW P
WVU 130 22 080S 210E 4304732307 5265 Federal OW P
WVFU 81 WG 24 0808 210E 4304733086 12436 Federal GW P
WVFU 54 WG 07 080S 220E 4304732821 12436 Federal GW P
WVFU 38 WG 08 080S 220E 4304732831 12436 Federal GW P
WVFU 49 WG 08 080S 220E 4304732832 12436 Federal GW P
WVU 145 18 080S 220E 4304731820 12436 Federal GW P
WVFU 69 WG 18 080S 220E 4304732829 12436 Federal GW P
WVFU 138 WG 18 080S 220E 4304733054 12436 Federal GW P

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2003

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2003

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/19/2003

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 5292864-0151

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

QEP UB 42 FORM



O O
6. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: 7/21/2003

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 7/21/2003

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,

for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: n/a

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 9/16/2003

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 9/16/2003

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: n/a

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: ala

STATE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965-003-032

FEDERAL WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESBOOOO24

INDIAN WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 799446

FEE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965-003-033

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: . n/a
The Division sent response by letter on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COM MENTS:

QEP UB 42 FORM



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. DJJ

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 1/1/2007

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2460-QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. N5085-QuestarE&P Company

1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265

Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900 Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900

CA No. Unit: WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

SEE ATTACHED LISTS *

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 4/19/2007

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 4/16/2007

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 1/31/2005

4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143

Sa. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a

Sc. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: n/a

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 4/23/2007 BIA

7. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 4/23/2007

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on:

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on:

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a

BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 799446
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965003033

3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS: THIS IS A COMPANY NAME CHANGE.
SOME WELL NAMES HAVE BEEN CHANGED AS REQUESTED

Questar E&P FORM A.xls 4/30/2007 AND



1 of 5 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
VVCUSSITSVALLEYUNIT

Original Well Name Well Name & No. Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type .Status

M"VLJ16 TIV 16 14E14E 15 080S 210E 4304715447 5265 Federal NVI A
VVVIJ31 M7V31 14EbPN 14 080S 210E 4304715460 5265 Federal VVI A
\VI/LJ35 3V'V35 FIESNV 14 080S 210E 4304715463 5265 Federal TVI A
VVV36 VVV36 NESTV 10 080S 210E 4304715464 5265 Federal VVI A
WVU 41 WV 41 NENW 15 080S 210E 4304715469 5265 Federal WI A
VVV43 TVV43 STVSNV 11 080S 210E 4304715471 5265 Federal OV/ P
VVV48 TVV48 STV>JE 10 080S 210E 4304715476 5265 Federal O'A' P
WVU 50 WV 50 SWNE 15 080S 210E 4304715477 5265 Federal WI A
VV\'53 3A"V53 STVSE 10 080S 210E 4304720003 5265 Federal OVV P
VTVU55 TVV55 SMG4E 14 080S 210E 4304720005 5265 Federal ONV P
WVU 59 WV 59 SWNW 14 080S 210E 4304720018 5265 Federal WI .A
3¥'VLJ 60 Vii'60 SVVSE 15 080S 210E 4304720019 5265 Federal 'NI A
TVV 62 VV\'62 :SVVSTV 10 080S 210E 4304720024 5265 Federal ONV P
TVVIJ65 VVV65 SYV>TA' 15 080S 210E 4304720041 5265 Federal ONV P
WVU 67 WV 67 NESW 15 080S 210E 4304720043 5265 Federal WI A
TV\rU 68 TV\T68 biESE 15 080S 210E 4304720047 5265 Federal 'ArI A
TVVU83 VTV83 TVGr NENIV 23 080S 210E 4304720205 14864 Federal GVV S
VVV97 TVi'97 FTV/STV 11 080S 210E 4304730014 5265 Federal 'ATI A
TVV1] 103 3WV103 FTAS49V 14 080S 210E 4304730021 5265 Federal ONV P
TVV1] 104 3NV 104 FDAS4E 15 080S 210E 4304730022 5265 Federal OVV P
TVV 105 VVV105 SESE 10 080S 210E 4304730023 5265 Federd OVV P
TVV1] 109 VVV109 SE14E 15 080S 210E 4304730045 5265 Federal ONV P
TVi3] 110 VVV110 SENTV 14 080S 210E 4304730046 5265 Federal OVV P
TVV1] 112 3¥V 112 SEFTA' 15 080S 210E 4304730048 5265 Federal OVV P
VVVIJ 124 M'V 124 Ì<¾VSE 15 080S 210E 4304730745 5265 Federal 139V P
WVU 126 WV 126 NWNE 21 080S 210E 4304730796 5265 Federal WI A
TVV 128 VTV 128 SESVV 10 080S 210E 4304730798 5265 Federd ONV P
TV\1] 132 VTV 132 NTVSTV 15 080S 210E 4304730822 5265 Federal ONV P
WVU 136 WV 136 NENW 21 080S 210E 4304731047 5265 Federal OW S
VVV 137 VVV137 SE1497 11 080S 210E 4304731523 5265 Federal 139/ P
VVV28-2 TVV28-2 NESVV 11 080S 210E 4304731524 99990 Federal NVI A
VVVU 133 \VV 133 SESVV 15 080S 210E 4304731706 5265 Federal ONV P
TVVU 140 M"V 140 149VT497 15 080S 210E 4304731707 5265 Federal 3YI A
WV 40-2 WV 40-2 NESE 10 080S 210E 4304731798 5265 Federal WI A
WVU 144 WV 144 SENE 10 080S 210E 4304731807 5265 Federal OW P
TVV 143 VVV143 149VSE 10 080S 210E 4304731808 5265 Federal TVI A
TV\T] 145 TVV 145 1(MnSTV 18 080S 220E 4304731820 14864 Federal GNV P
WVU 121 WV 121 [NWSW 14 080S 210E 4304731873 5265 Federal OW TA
WVU 135-2 WV 135-2 NENE 21 080S 210E 4304732016 5265 Federal OW P
WVU 130 WV 130 INWNW 22 080S 210E 4304732307 5265 Federal OW P
3A"VLJ71-2 TVV71-2 SYVSTV 15 080S 210E 4304732449 5265 Federal 'NI



2 of 5 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
WONSITS VALLEYUNIT

Original Well Name Well Name & No. Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

WVFU 119 WV 119 NWNW 21 080S 210E 4304732461 5265 Federal OW P
WVFU 120 WV 120 NENW 22 080S 210E 4304732462 5265 Federal WI A
WVFU 54 WG WV 54 WG SWSE 07 080S 220E 4304732821 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 69 WG WV 69 WG SWNE 18 080S 220E 4304732829 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 38 WG WV 38 WG SWNW 08 080S 220E 4304732831 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 49 WG WV 49 WG SWSW 08 080S 220E 4304732832 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 138 WG WV 138 WG SWNW 18 080S 220E 4304733054 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 14 WG WV 14 WG SWSE 12 080S 210E 4304733070 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 11 WG WV 11 WG SWNE 12 080S 210E 4304733085 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 81 WG WV 81 WG SWNW 24 080S 210E 4304733086 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 146 WG WV 146 WG NWNW 19 080S 220E 4304733128 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 1W-14-8- 21 WV 1W-14-8- 21 NENE 14 080S 210E 4304733220 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 5W-13- 8-21 WV 5W-13- 8-21 SWNW 13 080S 210E 4304733221 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 46 WG WVFU 46 WG NESE 07 080S 220E 4304733241 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 9W-14-8-21 WV 9W-14-8-21 NESE 14 080S 210E 4304733269 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 7W-13-8-21 WV 7W-13-8-21 SWNE 13 080S 210E ®4733270 14864 Federal GW _ P
WVFU lW-18-8-22 WV lW-18-8-22 NENE 18 080S 220E 4304733294 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 11W-8-8-22 WV llW-8-8-22 NESW 08 080S 220E 4304733295 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 3W-8-8-22 WV 3W-8-8-22 NENW 08 080S 220E 4304733493 14864 Federal GW S
WVFU 5W-7-8-22 WV 5W-7-8-22 SWNW 07 080S 220E 4304733494 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 11W-7-8-22 WV 11W-7-8-22 NESW 07 080S 220E 4304733495 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 13W-7-8-22 WV 13W-7-8-22 SWSW 07 080S 220E 4304733496 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU lW-7-8-22 WV 1W-7-8-22 NENE 07 080S 220E 4304733501 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 3W-7-8-22 WV 3W-7-8-22 NENW 07 080S 220E 4304733502 14864 Federal GW P
WV 7WRG-7-8-22 WV 7WRG-7-8-22 SWNE 07 080S 220E 4304733503 5265 Federal OW P
WVFU 16W-9-8-21 WV 16W-9-8-21 SESE 09 080S 210E 4304733529 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU lW-12-8-21 WV 1W-12-8-21 NENE 12 0808 210E 4304733531 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 1W-13-8-21 WV 1W-13-8-21 NENE 13 080S 210E 4304733532 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 3W-18-8-22 WV 3W-18-8-22 NENW 18 080S 20E 4304733533 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 9W-12-8-21 WV 9W-12-8-21 NESE 12 080S 210E 4304733534 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 11W-12-8-21 WV 11W-12-8-21 NESW 12 080S 210E 4304733535 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU llW-13-8-21 WV 11W-13-8-21 NESW 13 080S 210E 4304733536 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 13W-12-8-21 WV 13W-12-8-21 SWSW 12 080S 210E 4304733537 14864 Federal GW S
WVFU 13W-18-8-22 WV 13W-18-8-22 SWSW 18 080S 220E 4304733538 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 16G-9-8-21 WV 16G-9-8-21 SESE 09 080S 210E 4304733565 5265 Federal OW P
WVFU 1W-21-8-21 WV 1W-21-8-21 NENE 21 080S 210E 4304733602 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 3W-13-8-21 WV 3W-13-8-21 NENW 13 080S 210E 4304733603 14864 Federal GW S
WVFU 3W-22-8-21 WV 3W-22-8-21 NENW 22 080S 210E 4304733604 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 3W-24-8-21 WV 3W-24-8-21 NENW 24 080S 210E 4304733605 14864 Fedgal GW P
WVFU 13W-13-8-21 WV 13W-13-8-21 SWSW 13 080S 210E 4304733606 14864 Federal GW S
WVFU 13W-14-8-21 WV 13W-14-8-21 SWSW 14 080S 210E 4304733607 14864 Federal GW



3 of 5 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
WONSITS VALLEYUNIT

Original Well Name Well Name & No. Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

WVFU 15W-13-8-21 WV 15W-13-8-21 SWSE 13 080S 210E 4304733608 14864 Federal GW S
WVFU lW-24-8-21 WV 1W-24-8-21 NENE 24 080S 210E 4304733613 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 11W-18-8-22 WV llW-18-8-22 NESW 18 080S 220E 4304733626 14864 Federal GW P
WV 2W-10-8-21 WV 2W-10-8-21 NWNE 10 080S 210E 4304733655 14864 Federal GW P
WV4W-11-8-21 WV4W-11-8-21 NWNW___ll 080S 210E 4304733657 14864 Federal GW P
WV 12W-10-8-21 WV 12W-10-8-21 NWSW 10 080S 210E 4304733659 14864 Federal GW S
WV 12G-10-8-21 WV 12G-10-8-21 NWSW 10 080S 210E 4304733660 5265 Federal OW P

I

WVFU 15W-9-8-21 WV 15W-9-8-21 SWSE 09 080S 210E 4304733661 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 15G-9-8-21 WV 15G-9-8-21 SWSE 09 080S 210E 4304733662 5265 Federal OW P
WVFU 2W-13-8-21 WV 2W-13-8-21 NWNE 13 080S 210E 4304733791 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 6W-13-8-21 WV 6W-13-8-21 SENW 13 080S 210E 4304733792 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 8W-13-8-21 WV 8W-13-8-21 SENE 13 080S 210E 4304733793 14864 Federal GW P
WV 10W-1-8-21 WV 10W-1-8-21 NWSE 01 080S 210E 4304733794 14864 Federal A
WVFU 10W-13-8-21 WV 10W-13-8-21 NWSE 13 080S 210E 4304733795 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 12W-7-8-22 WV 12W-7-8-22 NWSW 07 080S 220E 4304733808 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 6W-8-8-22 WV 6W-8-8-22 SENW 08 080S 220E 4304733811 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 7W-8-8-22 WV 7W-8-8-22 SWNE 08 080S 220E 4304733812 14864 Federal GW S
WVFU 10W-7-8-22 WV 10W-7-8-22 NWSE 07 080S 220E 4304733813 14864 Federal GW
WVFU 12W-8-8-22 WV 12W-8-8-22 NWSW 08 080S 220E 4304733815 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 14W-7-8-22 WV 14W-7-8-22 SESW 07 080S 220E 4304733816 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 16W-7-8-22 WV 16W-7-8-22 SESE 07 080S 220E 4304733817 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 6W-7-8-22 WV 6W-7-8-22 SENW 080S 22 E 4304733828 14864 Federal _ GW P
WVFU 6W-18-8-22 WV 6W-18-8-22 SENW 18 080S 220E 4304733842 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 6WC-18-8-22 WV 6WC-18-8-22 SENW 18 080S 220E 4304733843 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 6WD-18-8-22 WV 6WD-18-8-22 SENW 18 080S 220E 4304733844 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 5W-23-8-21 WV 5W-23-8-21 SWNW 23 080S 210E 4304733860 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 7W-23-8-21 WV 7W-23-8-21 SWNE 23 080S 210E 4304733861 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 8W-12-8-21 WV 8W-12-8-21 SENE 12 080S 210E 4304733862 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 10W-12-8-21 WV 10W-12-8-21 NWSE 12 080S 210E 4304733863 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 14W-12-8-21 WV 14W-12-8-21 SESW 12 080S 210E 4304733864 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 16W-12-8-21 WV 16W-12-8-21 SESE 12 080S 210E 4304733865 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU lW-15-8-21 WV 1W-15-8-21 NENE 15 080S 210E 4304733902 14864 Federal GW S
WVFU lW-22-8-21 WV lW-22-8-21 NENE 22 080S 210E 4304733903 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 1W-23-8-21 WV IW-23-8-21 NENE 23 080S 210E 4304733904 14864 Federal GW P
WV 6W-11-8-21 WV 6W-11-8-21 SENW 11 080S 210E 4304733906 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 7W-24-8-21 WV 7W-24-8-21 SWNE 24 080S 210E 4304733908 14864 Federal GW P
WV 10W-11-8-21 WV 10W-11-8-21 NWSE 11 080S 210E 4304733910 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 11W-15-8-21 WV 11W-15-8-21 NESW _15 080S 210E 4304733911 14864 Federal GW P
WV 13W-11-8-21 WV 13W-11-8-21 SWSW 11 080S 210E 4304733913 14864 Federal GW S
WVFU 13W-15-8-21 WV 13W-15-8-21 SWSW 15 080S 210E 4304733914 14864 Federal GW P
WV 15W-10-8-21 WV 15W-10-8-21 SWSE 10 080S 210E 4304733916 14864 Federal GW



4 of 5 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
WONSITS VALLEYUNIT

Original Well Name Well Name & No. Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

WVFU 15W-15-8-21 WV 15W-15-8-21 SWSE 15 080S 210E 4304733917 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 5W-14-8-21 WV 5W-14-8-21 SWNW 14 080S 210E 4304733953 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 7W-14-8-21 WV 7W-14-8-21 SWNE 14 080S 210E 4304733955 14864 Federal GW P
WV 8W-11-8-21 WV 8W-11-8-21 SENE i 11 080S 210E 4304733957 14864 Federal GW S
WVFU 8W-14-8-21 WV 8W-14-8-21 SENE 14 080S 210E 04733958 14864 Federal GW
WVFU 9W-15-8-21 WV 9W-15-8-21 NESE . 15 080S 210E 4304733959 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 12W-13-8-21 WV 12W-13-8-21 NWSW 13 080S 210E 4304733961 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 14W-13-8-21 WV 14W-13-8-21 SESW 13 080S 210E 4304733962 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 15W-14-8-21 WV 15W-14-8-21 SWSE 14 080S 210E 4304733963 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 2W-18-8-22 WV 2W-18-8-22 NWNE 18 080S 220E 4304733986 14864 Federal GW P
WV 8W-18-8-22 WV 8W-18-8-22 SENE 18 080S 220E 4304733989 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 10W-18-8-22 WV 10W-18-8-22 NWSE 18 080S 220E 4304733991 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 12W-18-8-22 WV 12W-18-8-22 NWSW 18 080S 220E 4304733993 14864 Federal GW P
WV 14W-18-8-22 WV 14W-18-8-22 SESW 18 080S 220E 4304733995 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 8W-1-8-21 WV 8W-1-8-21 SENE 01 080S 210E 4304734009 14864 Federal GW DRL
WV 4W-17-8-22 WV 4W-17-8-22 NWNW 17 080S 220E 4304734038 14864 Federal GW P
WV 12G-1-8-21 WV 12G-1-8-21 NWSW 01 080S 210E 4304734108 5265 Federal OW TA
WV 2W-14-8-21 WV 2W-14-8-21 NWNE 14 080S 210E 4304734140 14864 Federal GW P
GH 2W-21-8-21 GH 2W-21-8-21 NWNE 21 080S 210E 4304734141 14864 Federal GW P
WV 2W-23-8-21 WV 2W-23-8-21 NWNE 23 080S 210E 4304734142 14864 Federal GW P
GH 3W-21-8-21 WV 3W-21-8-21 NENW 21 080S 210E 4304734143 14864 Federal GW P
WV 4W-13-8-21 WV 4W-13-8-21 NWNW 13 080S 210E 4304734144 14864 Federal GW P
GH 4W-21-8-21 WV 4W-21-8-21 NWNW 21 080S 210E 4304734145 14864 Federal GW P
WV 4W-22-8-21 WV 4W-22-8-21 NWNW 22 080S 210E 4304734146 14864 Federal GW P
WV 16W-ll-8-21 WV 16W-11-8-21 SESE 11 080S 210E 4304734155 14864 Federal GW TA
WV 3W-19-8-22 WV 3W-19-8-22 NENW 19 080S 220E 4304734187 14864 Federal GW P
WV 4W-23-8-21 WV 4W-23-8-21 NWNW 23 080S 210E 4304734188 14864 Federal GW P
WV 6W-23-8-21 WV 6W-23-8-21 SENW 23 080S 210E 4304734189 14864 Federal GW P
WV 2W-15-8-21 WV 2W-15-8-21 NWNE 15 080S 210E 4304734242 14864 Federal GW P
WV 2W-22-8-21 WV 2W-22Jál NWNE 22 080S 210E 4304734243 14864 Federal GW P
WV 4W-14-8-21 WV 4W-14-8-21 NWNW 14 080S 210E 4304734244 14864 Federal GW P
WV 6W-12-8-21 WV 6W-12-8-21 SENW 12 080S 210E 4304734245 5265 Federal GW S
WV 7W-15-8-21 WV 7W-15-8-21 SWNE 15 080S 210E 4304734246 14864 Federal GW P
WV 8W-15-8-21 WV 8W-15-8-21 SENE 15 080S 210E 4304734247 14864 Federal GW P
WV 12W-12-8-21 WV 12W-12-8-21 NWSW 12 080S 210E 4304734248 14864 Federal GW S
WV 14W-15-8-21 WV 14W-15-8-21 SESW 15 080S 210E 4304734249 14864 Federal GW P
WV 16W-10-8-21 WV 16W-10-8-21 SESE 10 080S 210E 4304734250 14864 Federal GW P
WV 16W-15-8-21 WV 16W-15-8-21 SESE 15 080S 210E 4304734251 14864 Federal GW P
WV 2W-12-8-21 WV 2W-12-8-5 NWNE 12 080S 210E 4304734265 14864 Federal GW P
WV 3W-12-8-21 WV 3W-12-8-21 NENW 12 080S 210E 4304734267 14864 Federal GW |OPS
WV 4W-12-8-21 WV 4D-12-8-21 NWNW 12 080S 210E . 4304734268 12436 Federal GW



5 of 5 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
WONSITS VALLEYUNIT

Original Well Name Well Name & No. Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

WV 5W-12-8-21 WV 5W-12-8-21 SWNW 12 080S 210E 4304734270 14864 Federal GW OPS
WV 6W-14-8-21 WV 6W-14-8-21 SENW 14 080S 210E 4304734271 14864 Federal GW P
WV 9W-11-8-21 WV 9W-11-8-21 NESE 11 080S 210E 4304734274 14864 Federal GW DRL
WV 10W-14-8-21 WV 10W-14-8-21 NWSE 14 080S 210E 4304734275 14864 Federal GW S
WV 11W-14-8-21 WV llW-14-8-21 NESW 14 080S 210E 4304734277 14864 Federal GW P
WV 12W-14-8-21 WV 12W-14-8-21 NWSW 14 080S 210E 4304734279 14864 Federal GW S
WV 14M-11-8-21 WV 14M-11-8-21 SESW 11 080S 210E 4304734280 14864 Federal GW P
WV 14W-14-8-21 WV 14W-14-8-21 SESW 14 080S 210E 4304734281 14864 Federal GW P
WV 16W-14-8-21 WV 16G-14-8-21 SESE 14 080S 210E 4304734283 5265 Federal OW S
WV 3MU-15-8-21 WV 3MU-15-8-21 NENW 15 080S 210E 4304734289 14864 Federal GW P
WV 4MU-15-8-21 WV 4MU-15-8-21 NWNW 15 080S 210E 4304734291 14864 Federal GW P
WV 5MU-15-8-21 WV 5MU-15-8-21 SWNW 15 080S 210E 4304734293 14864 Federal GW
WV 6W-15-8-21 WV 6W-15-8-21 SENW 15 080S 210E 4304734294 14864 Federal GW P
WV 10W-15-8-21 WV 10W-15-8-21 NWSE 15 080S 210E 4304734295 14864 Federal GW P
WVU 4W-24-8-21 WV 4W-24-8-21 NWNW 24 080S 210E 4304734330 14864 Federal GW P
WV 8M-23-8-21 WV 8M-23-8-21 SENE 23 080S 210E 4304734339 14864 Federal GW P
WVU 8W-24-8-21 WV 8W-24-8-21 SENE 24 080S 210E 4304734340 14864 Federal GW P
WV 2W-8-8-22 WV 2W-8-8-22 NWNE 08 080S 220E 4304734468 14864 Federal GW P
WV 8W-7-8-22 WV 8W-7-8-22 SENE 07 080S 220E 4304734469 14864 Federal GW S
WV 8W-22-8-21 WV 8W-22-8-21 SENE 22 080S 210E 4304734564 14864 Federal GW P
WV 3G-8-8-22 WV 3G-8-8-22 NENW 08 080S 220E 4304734596 5265 Federal OW TA

WV 14MU-10-8-21 WV 14MU-10-8-21 SESW 10 080S 210E 4304735879 14864 Federal GW P
WV 13MU-10-8-21 WV 13MU-10-8-21 SWSW 10 080S 210E 4304736305 14864 Federal GW P
WV 3DML-13-8-21 WV 3D-13-8-21 SENW 13 080S 210E 4304737923 14864 Federal GW DIiL
WV 14DML-12-8-21 WV 14DML-12-8-21 SESW 12 080S 210E 4304737924 14864 Federal GW DRL
WV 15AML-12-8-21 WV 15AML-12-8-21 NWSE 12 080S 210E 4304737925 Federal GW APD
WV 13DML-10-8-21 WV 13DML-10-8-21 SWSW 10 080S 210E 4304737926 14864 Federal GW P
WV 4DML-15-8-21 WV 4DML-15-8-21 NWNW 15 080S 210E 4304737927 14864 Federal GW DRL
WV 13AD-8-8-22 WV 13AD-8-8-22 SWSW 08 080S 220E 4304737945 Federal GW APD
WV 11AML-14-8-21 WV llAD-14-8-21 NWSE 14 080S 210E 4304738049 15899 Federal GW APD
WV 11DML-14-8-21 WV 11DML-14-8-21 SESW 14 080S 210E 4304738050 Federal GW APD
WV 4AML-19-8-22 WV 4AML-19-8-22 NWNW 19 080S 220E 4304738051 Federal GW APD
WV 13CML-8-8-22 WV 13CML-8-8-22 SWSW 08 080S 220E 4304738431 Federal GW APD
WV 13BML-18-8-22 WV 13BML-18-8-22 SWSW 18 080S 220E 4304738432 Federal GW APD
WV 8BML-18-8-22 WV 8BML-18-8-22 E/NE 18 080S 220E 4304738433 Federal GW APD
WV 6ML-24-8-21 WV 6-24-8-21 SENW 24 080S 210E 4304738663 Federal GW APD
WV 2ML-24-8-21 WV 2ML-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304738664 Federal GW APD
WV 1DML-13-8-21 WV 1DML-13-8-21 NENE 13 080S 210E 4304738733 Åderal GW APD
WV 4DML-13-8-21 WV 4DML-13-8-21 NWNW 13 080S 210E 4304738734 Federal GW APD
WV 3AML-14-8-21 WV 3AML-14-8-21 NENW 14 080S 210E 4304738736 Federal GW APD
WV 16CML-14-8-21 WV 16C-14-8-21 SESE 14 080S 210E 4304738737 Federal GW



1 of 2 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
WONSITS VALLEYUNIT

Original Well Name Well Name & No. Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

WVU 21 WV 21 NENE 16 080S 210E 4304715452 99990 State WI A
WVU 32 WV 32 NENW 16 080S 210E 4304716513 5265 State OW P
WVU 72 WV 72 SWSW 16 080S 210E 4304720058 99990 State WI A
WVU 73 WV 73 NESE 16 080S 210E 4304720066 5265 State WI A
WVU 74 WV 74 SWSE 16 080S 210E 4304720078 5265 State OW P
WVU 75 WV 75 SWNE 16 080S 210E 4304720085 5265 State OW P
WVU 78 WV 78 NESW 16 080S 210E 4304720115 99990 State WI A
WVU 134 WV 134 SESE 16 080S 210E 4304731118 5265 State OW P
WVU 141 WV 141 NWSE 16 080S 210E 4304731609 5265 State OW P
WVU 127 WV 127 SENE 16 080S 210E 4304731611 5265 State OW P
WVU 142 WV 142 SESW 16 080S 210E 4304731612 5265 State OW P
WVFU 9W-13-8-21 WV 9W-13-8-21 NESE 13 080S 210E 4304733223 14864 State GW S
WVFU 2W-16-8-21 WV 2W-16-8-21 NWNE 16 080S 210E 4304733246 14864 State GW P
WVFU 2G-16-8-21 WV 2G-16-8-21 NWNE 16 080S 210E 4304733247 5265 State OW P
WVFU 6W-16-8-21 WV 6W-16-8-21 SENW 16 080S 210E 4304733527 14864 State GW P
WVFU 6G-16-8-21 WV 6G-16-8-21 SENW 16 080S 210E 4304733564 5265 State OW P
WVFU 16W-2-8-21 WV 16W-2-8-21 SESE 02 080S 210E 4304733645 5265 State OW S
WVFU 9W-2-8-21 WV 9W-2-8-21 NESE 02 080S 210E 4304733648 14864 State GW P
WVFU 12W-16-8-21 WV 12W-16-8-21 NWSW 16 080S 210E 4304733649 14864 State GW P
WVFU 12G-16-8-21 WV 12G-16-8-21 NWSW 16 080S 210E 4304733650 5265 State OW P
WVFU 16W-13-8-21 WV 16W-13-8-21 SESE 13 080S 210E 4304733796 14864 State GW P
WV 10G-2-8-21 WV 10G-2-8-21 NWSE 02 080S 210E 4304734035 5265 State OW P
WV 14G-2-8-21 WV 14G-2-8-21 SESW 02 080S 210E 4304734036 5265 State OW P
WV 13G-2-8-21 WV 13G-2-8-21 SWSW 02 080S 210E 4304734068 5265 State OW P
WV 5G-16-8-21 WV 5G-16-8-21 SWNW 16 080S 210E 4304734107 5265 State OW P
WV llW-16-8-21 WV llW-16-8-21 NESW 16 080S 210E 4304734190 14864 State GW P
WV 13W-16-8-21 WV 13W-16-8-21 SWSW 16 080S 210E 4304734191 14864 State GW P
WV 14W-16-8-21 WV 14W-16-8-21 SESW 16 080S 210E 4304734192 14864 State GW P
WV 15W-16-8-21 WV 15W-16-8-21 SWSE 16 080S 210E 4304734224 14864 State GW P
WV 16W-16-8-21 WV 16W-16-8-21 SESE 16 080S 210E 4304734225 14864 State GW P
WV 1MU-16-8-21 WV 1MU-16-8-21 NENE 16 080S 210E 4304734288 14864 State GW P
WV 3W-16-8-21 WV 3W-16-8-21 10E 4304734290 State GW LA
WV 4W-16-8-21 WV 4W-16-8-21 NWNW 16 080S 210E 4304734292 12436 State D PA
WVU 5W-16-8-21 WV 5W-16-8-21 SWNW 16 080S 210E 4304734321 14864 State GW P
WV 7W-16-8-21 WV 7W-16-8-21 SWNE 16 080S 210E 4304734322 14864 State GW P
WV 8ML-16-8-21 WV 8ML-16-8-21 SENE 16 080S 210E 4304734323 14864 State GW P
WV 9W-16-8-21 WV 9W-16-8-21 NESE 16 080S 210E 4304734325 14864 State GW P
WV 10W-16-8-21 WV 10W-16-8-21 NWSE 16 080S 210E 4304734326 14864 State GW P
WV 12BML-16-8-21 WV 12BML-16-8-21 SWNW 16 080S 210E 4304737824 14864 State GW P
WV 12DML-16-8-21 WV 12D-16-8-21 NWSW 16 080S 210E 4304737870 State GW APD
WV 15CML-16-8-21 WV 15CML-16-8-21 SESW 16 080S 210E 4304737871 14864 State GW



2 of 2 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
WONSITS VALLEYUNIT
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WV 15DML-16-8-21 WV 15DML-16-8-21 SWSE 16 080S 2iiE 4304737872 State GW APD
WV 16DML-13-8-21 WV 16DML-13-8-21 SESE 13 080S 210E 4304738735 State GW



STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENT OF NATIURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

see attached
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

seeadached
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do not use this form for proposals to drillnewwells,significantly deepen existing wellsbelow current bottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells,or to See attacheddrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERadlT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WEl.L NAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL O GAS WELL OTHER see attached
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANY attached

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1050 17th Street Suite 500 crrr Denver

sTArE CO ,80265 (303) 308-3068
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: attached COUNTY: Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit în Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

1/1/2007 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of workcompletion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: Operator Name
O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Change

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective January 1, 2007 operator of record, QEP' Uinta Basin, Inc., willhereafter be known as QUESTAR EXPLORATION
AND PRODUCTION COMPANY. This name change involves only an internal corporate name change and no thirdparty
change ofoperator is involved. The same employees willcontinue to be responsible for operationsofthe properties described
on the attached list. AIIoperations willcontinue to be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLMReference No. ESBOOOO24)
Utah State Bond Number: 965003033
Fee Land Bond Number: 965003033
Current operator of record, QEP UINTABASIN, IN hereby ' igns as operatorof the properties as described on the
attached list.

Ja , Executive Vice President, QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
Successor operator of record, QUESTAR EXPLORATI ND P UCTION COMPANY, hereby assumes all rights, duties
and obligations as operator of the properties as desc d on the ached list

Ja Neese, Exe tiveVice President
Q star Exploration and Production Company

D " a K. Stanberry
TITLE Supervisor, RegulatoryAffairsNAME (PLEASE PRINT)

SIGNATURE DATE 3/16/2007

(This space for Stato use only)

APRI S 2007
(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse



STATEOFUTAH FORMS
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OlL GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
see attached

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 IFINDIAN AcLL EEÖRTRIBENAME:

7. UNlTor CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do not use thisform for proposals todr11Inew wells, significantly deepen existingwellsbelow currentbottom41oledepth, reenterplugged wells,or to See attacheddrill horizontal laterals Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1 ŸYPËÒÑWÈLË 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER see attached
i. NÃMEÒF ÕPËËÁTÖR: 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY attached

3 ÄDDRESS OF ÒPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1050 17th Street Suite 500 Denver srgre CO ,80265 (303) 308-3068

4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: attached COUNTY: Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work wißstart: CASING REPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

1/1/2007 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of workcompletion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: Well Name Changes
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearly showall pertinent details includingdates, depths, volumes, etc.

PER THE ATTACHED LIST OF WELLS, QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANYREQUESTS THATTHE
INDIVIDUAL WELL NAMES BE UPDATED INYOUR RECORDS.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) TITLE Supervisor, Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATURE BA 4/17/2007

(This spaoo for State use only)

RECEIVED
APRLS2007(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side)

DROF0it,GASA



United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

ac2E Utah State Office T^KE PRLD
P.O. Box 45155 NAM ERICA

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
UT-922

April 23, 2007

Questar Exploration and Production Company
1050 17th Street, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265

Re: Wonsits Valley Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

On April 12, 2007, we received an indenture dated April 6, 2007, whereby QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
resigned as Unit Operator and Questar Exploration and Production Company was designated as
Successor Unit Operator for the Wonsits Valley Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effectiveApril23,2007.
In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the

designated party has obtained all required approval that would entitle itto conduct operations under
the Wonsits Valley Unit Agreement.

Your nationwideoiland gas bond No. ESBOOOO24willbe used to cover allfederal operations within
the Wonsits Valley Unit.

It is requested that you notifyall interested parties of the change in unit operator. Copies of the
approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriate federal offices, withone copy returned
herewith.

Sincerely,

Is/ Greg J. Noble

Greg J. Noble
Acting Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure
bcc: Field Manager - Vernal (wlenclosure)

SITLA
Division of Oil,Gas & Mining
File - Wonsits Valley Unit (wlenclosure)
Agr. Sec. Chron
Reading File RECEN -

Central Files
UT922:TAThompson:tt:4/23/07 AŸ

Og OF0\L



API Well No: 43047318730000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-0807 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 WONSITS VALLEY 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 WV 121 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO 

9. API NUMBER:
 43047318730000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, UT, 84078 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 WONSITS VALLEY 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2313 FSL 0653 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSW Section: 14 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

12/1/2010

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 This well was originally drilled and completed in the G-1 limestone member of
the Green River formation. This well was shut in due to high WOR and
unsatisfactory economics. During drilling, oil shows were noted from

4491'-4498', 4510'4513', 4550'-4556'. Questar Exploration and Production
Company (QEP) would like to reserve this wellbore for future testing of these

zones. QEP requests 12 month extension of TA status.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Jan Nelson

TITLE
 Permit Agent

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 12/14/2009

PHONE NUMBER:
435 781-4362  Ext 

 

PHONE NUMBER
435 781-4331

December 14, 2009

December 14, 2009

iPI Well No: 43047318730000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EASOE7DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6.IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well WV 121

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO 43047318730000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-4362 Ext WONSITS VALLEY

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

2313 FSL 0653 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWSW Section: 14 Township: 08.05 Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

12/1/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of work completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

This well was originally drilled and completed in the G-1 limestone member of
the Green River formation. This well was shut in due to high WOR and REQUEST DENIED
unsatisfactory economics. During drilling, oil shows were noted from Utah Division of

4491'-4498', 4510'4513', 4550'-4556'. Questar Exploration and Production Oil, Gas and Mining
Company (QEP) would like to reserve this wellbore for future testing of these

zones. QEP requests 12 month extension of TA status. Date: De embe 'T4 2009 .

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jan Nelson 435 781-4331 Permit Agent

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 12/14/2009

RECEIVED December 14,



  

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43047318730000

See requirements of R649-3-36 that are needed for extended SI/TA approval. Must show
well has integrity. 

December 14, 2009December 14, 2009

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources
Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

OIL GAS & M1NTNG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43047318730000

See requirements of R649-3-36 that are needed for extended SI/TA approval. Must show
well has integrity.

st-¢WEGETcDBþtEB
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/14/2010

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N5085-QuestarExploration and Production Company N3700-QEP Energy Company

1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265

Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048 Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048

CA No. Unit: WONSITS VALLEY
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

NO TYPE STATUS
SEE ATTACHED

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/28/2010
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/28/2010
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/24/2010
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Requested
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 8/16/2010 BIA not yet
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 8/16/2010
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 6/29/2010
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/30/2010
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/30/2010
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965010693
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965010695
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a
COMMENTS:

QEP Enerav (Wnnn¡tm vailm,\ muu a vi- a on



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OlL, GAS ANDMINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANOSERIALNUMBER

See attached
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS See attached
7 UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° See attacheddrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for such proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL
8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER
See attached

2 NAeMEOF o
Xplo tionand Production Company ÁÛ$ Att ch

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WiLDCAT:1050 17th Street, Suite 500 Denver a CO ,,80265 (303) 672-6900 See attached
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: See attached COUNTY: Attached

QTR/QTR. SECTION. TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE
UTAH

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICEOF INTENT
(Subminn Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

6/14/2010 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE
SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BAGK WATER DISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUT-OFFDate of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: Operator Name
O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENTFORMATION Change

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearty show all pedinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective June 14, 2010 Questar Exploration and Production Company changed its name to QEP Energy Company. This namechange involves only an internal corporate name change and no thirdparty change of operator is involved. The sameemployees willcontinue to be responsible for operations of the properties described on the attached list. All operations willcontinue to be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLM Reference No. ESBOOOO24)
Utah State Bond Number: 965668683
Fee Land Bond Number: M
BIA Bond Number: 799448- Ñ/p Š^Ð/O

(4 /3
The attached document is an all inclusive list of the wells operated by Questar Exploration and Production Company. As ofJune 14, 2010 QEP Energy Company assumes all rights, duties and obligationsas operator of the properties as described onthe list

NAME(PLEASE P Morgan Anderson
TITLE Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURg DATE 6/23/2010

(This space for State use only)

RECElVED APPROVED / B0 9
JUN2 8 2010

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
ÛÎVÎSÎOR Of Oll,GasandMiningDIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING Earlene Russell, Engineering



Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
WONSITS VALLEY

efectiveJune 14,2010

well_name see twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
leaseHEV43 11 080S 210E 4304715471 5265 Fedend ONV P

VVV48 10 080S 210E 4304715476 5265 Federed CA¥ P
TVV53 10 080S 210E 4304720003 5265 Federed ()¾7 PTVi?55 14 080S 210E 4304720005 5265 Federal ()VV PW62 10 080S 210E 4304720024 5265 Federal OW P
TVV65 15 080S 210E 4304720041 5265 Federed OVV P
WV 83 WG 23 080S 210E 4304720205 17123 Federal GW P
97V 103 14 080S 210E 4304730021 5265 Federed ONV P
97V 104 15 080S 210E 4304730022 5265 Federed ONV P
97V 105 10 080S 210E 4304730023 5265 Federal ONV P
VVV109 15 080S 210E 4304730045 5265 Federed ONV P
WV 110

17¯080S
210E 4304730046 5265 Federal OW P

NTV 112 15 080S 210E 4304730048 5265 Federed ONV P
VŒV124 15 080S 210E 4304730745 5265 Federed OTV P
TVV128 10 080S 210E 4304730798 5265 Fedehd ONV P9V\r132 15 080S 210E 4304730822 5265 Federal (39V P
97V 136 21 080S 210E 4304731047 5265 Federal ONV S
VVV137 11 080S 210E 4304731523 5265 Federed ONV P
NTV133 15 080S 210E 4304731706 5265 Federed OTV P
TV 144 10 080S 210E 4304731807 5265 Federed ONV P
WV 145 18 080S 220E 4304731820 17123 Federal GW P
VVV121 14 080S 210E 4304731873 5265 Federed ONV T'AYV 135-2 21 080S 210E 4304732016 5265 Federed ONV P
VVV130 22 080S 210E 4304732307 5265 Federed ONV P
VVV119 21 080S 210E 4304732461 5265 Federed ONV PSVV543WG 07 080S 220E 4304732821 17123 Federed GB¥ P
VVi'69 TVGi 18 080S 220E 4304732829 17123 Federal GVV P
VVV38VVGi 08 080S 220E 4304732831 17123 Federal GBW P
WV 49 WG 08 080S 220E 4304732832 17123 Federal GW P
WV 138 WG 18 080S 220E 4304733054 17123 i Federal GW .P
VVV149VGi 12 080S 210E 4304733070 17123 Federed Ciwi P
WV 11 WG 12 080S 210E 4304733085 17123 Federal GW P
VVV819VG 24 080S 210E 4304733086 17123 Federed GNV S
VV 1461¥G 19 080S 220E 4304733128 17123 Federed GINVP
WV lW-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733220 17123 Federal GW P
WV 5W-13- 8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733221 17123 Federal GW ¡PTV37FU469VGi 07 080S 220E 4304733241 17123 Federed GB¥ P
WV 9W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733269 17123 Federal GW P
WV 7W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733270 17123 Federal GW P
WV lW-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733294 17123 Federal GW P
WV 11W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733295 17123 Federal GW P
WV 3W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733493 17123 Federal GW SVVi'59V-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733494 17123 Federal GVV S
WV 11W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733495 17123 Federal GW P
WV 13W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733496 17123 Federal GW P
WV lW-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733501 17123 Federal GW P
WV 3W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733502 17123 Federal GW P
WV 7WRG-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733503 5265 Federal OW P
TVi' 165V-9-8-21 09 080S 210E 4304733529 17123 Federal (39V P

Bonds:BLM= ESBOOOO24
BIA=956010693

State= 965010695 1 of



Questar ExplorationProduction Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
WONSITS VALLEY

efectiveJune 14,2010

well_name sec twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
leaseWV lW-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733531 17123 Federal GW S

TV3719V-13-8-21 13 080S 210·E 4304733532 17123 Federal (JVV SVV3739V-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733533 17123 Federal (39V PWV 9W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733534 17123 Federal GW P
TV\T llyV-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733535 17123 Federal (ITV PVVil119V-13-8-21 13 080S 2101E4304733536 17123 Federal (39V PVVi'139V-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733537 17123 Federal (39V SVVif139V-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733538 17123 Federal (39V PWV 16G-9-8-21 09 080S 210E 4304733565 5265 Federal OW PVVit1\V-21-8-:21 21 080S 210E 4304733602 17123 Federal GNV P
WV 3W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733603 17123 Federal GW SWV 3W-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304733604 17123 Federal GWVVi'39V-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304733605 17123 Federal GNV PVVir139V-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733607 17123 Federal (39V PTVit 15V-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304733613 17123 Federal GVV P
yV_ 11_W 8-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733626

_

17123 Federal GW PVV\729V-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304733655 17123 Federal GVV PVV\'49V-ll-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304733657 17123 Federal (ITV P
VV37129V-10-8-21 10 080S 210·E 4304733659 17123 Federal (ITV SWV 12G-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304733660 5265 Federal OW P
TV\' 159V-9-8-:21 09 080S 210E 4304733661 17123 Federal GNV P
WV 15G-9-8-21 09 080S 210E 4304733662 5265 Federal lOWVV\'21V-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733791 17123 Federal GYVTV3/69V-13-8-21 13 080S 210·E 4304733792 17123 Federal (19V PVV\/89V-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733793 17123 Federal GVV P
WV 10W-1-8-21 01 080S 210E 4304733794 17123 Federal GW TATV3710TV-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733795 17123 Federal (19V PVVV12\V-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733808 17123 Federal GA¥ PVV3769V-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733811 17123 Federal 439V P
\Y3779V-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733812 17123 Federal (19V P
NY'l 10TV-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733813 17123 Federal (39V PTV37129V-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733815 17123 Federal GNV P
TV37149V-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733816 17123 Federal (19V P
TVi' 169V-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733817 17123 Federal GVV P
WV 6W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733828 17123 Federal GW P
WV 6W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733842 17123 Federal GW P
WV 6WC-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733843 17123 Federal GW P
WV 6WD-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733844 17123 Federal GW PTV3759V-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304733860 17123 Federal (39V PgrVTW'-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304733861 17123 Federed GAV P
TV3/89V-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733862 17123 Federal (39V P
TVV 10\V-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733863 17123 Federal GVV PTVi7149V-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733864 17123 Federal GVV P
WV 16W-12-8-21 12 080$ 210E 4304733865 17123 Federal GW PTV3719¥-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304733902 17123 Federal (19V STVi/13¥-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304733903 17123 Federed Cin' S
NV\T INV-23-8-:21 23 080S 210E 4304733904 17123 Federal (39V DP
WV 6W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304733906 17123 Federal GW PTVi/79V-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304733908 17123 Federal 939V IP

Bonds:BLhn = EfsBOOOO24
BIA=956010693

S:tate = 965010695 2 of



Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
WONSITSVALLEY

e#ectiveJune 14,2010

well name see twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease

TVV10NV-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304733910 17123 Federal G'ñW P
TV\' 119V-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304733911 17123 Federal GNV P
WV 13W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304733913 17123 Federal GW SVVir139V-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304733914 17123 Federal GNV P
WV 15W-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304733916 17123 Federal GW PVVil 159V-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304733917 17123 Federal (39V PVVir59V-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733953 17123 Federal GVV PTV3775V-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733955 17123 Federal (19V P
VVV89V-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304733957 _ 17123 Federal GYV SVV3789V-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733958 | 17123 Federal (39V PVViT99V-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304733959 | 17123 Federal GYV P
TV31129V-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733961 17123 Federal (39V PVV37149V-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733962 17123 Federal (INV P
TV37159V-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733963 17123 Federal (39V PVVi'29V-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733986 17123 Federal GNV PTVV89V-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733989 17123 Federal GB¥ P
VV3710TV-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733991 17123 Iù>deral (ITV P
WV 12W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733993 17123 Federal GW S\Y,7 149V-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733995 17123 Federal GNV P
WV 8W-1-8-21 01 080S 210E 4304734009 17123 Federal GW OPS C
WV 4W-17-8-22

_

17 WOS 220E 4304734038 17123 Federal GW P
WV 12G-1-8-21 01 080S 210E 4304734108 5265 Federal OW TA
SV3/29V-14-8-21 14 080S 210·E 4304734140 17123 Federal (39V P
GH 2W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734141 17123 Federal GW P
TVV2NV-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304734142 17123 Fedeñd GA¥ P
VVV31V-21-8-:21 21 080S 210E 4304734143 17123 Fedeñd G'A¥ P
WV 4W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304734144 17123 Federal GW PTV\'49V-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734145 17123 Federal GNV P
TVV49V-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304734146 17123 Federal (19V P
WV 16W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304734155 5265 Federal GW P
TV'l 39V-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734187 17123 Federal (39V P
TVi'41V-23-8-:21 23 080S 210E 4304734188 17123 Fedend GA¥ P
WV 6W-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304734189 17123 Federal GW S
TV\T2NV-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734242 17123 Federal GVV PVV\725V-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304734243 17123 Federal GNV P
WV 4W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734244 17123 Federal GW S
WV 6W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304734245 5265 Federal GW TA
pç\r79V-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734246 17123 Federal (39V P
WV 8W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734247 17123 Federal GW PVV\'129V-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304734248 17123 Federal GVV Trt
WV 14W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734249 17123 Federal GW PTVir 169V-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304734250 17123 Federal GNV P
WV 16W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734251 17123 Federal GW P
WV 3W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304734267 123 Federal GW OPS C
WV 4D-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304734268 17123 Federal GW OPS C
WV 6W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734271 17123 Federal GW S
WV 9W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304734274 17123 Federal GW OPS C
WV 10W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734275 17123 Federal GW P
WV 11W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734277 17123 Federal GW P

Bonds:BLhn = EISBOOOO24
BIA=956010693
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Questar ExplorationProduction Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
WONSITS VALLEY

effective June 14, 2010

well name sec twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease

WV 12W-14-8-2I 14 080S 210E 4304734279 17123 Federal GW TA
WV 14M-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304734280 17123 Federal GW P
WV 14W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734281 17123 Federal GW S
WV 16G-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734283 5265 Federal OW P
WV 3MU-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734289 17123 Federal GW P
WV 4MU-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734291 17123 Federal GW P
WV 5MU-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734293 17123 Federal GW P
WV 6W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734294 17123 Federal GW P
WV 10W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734295 17123 Federal GW P
WV 4W-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304734330 17123 Federal GW P
WV 8M-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304734339 17123 Federal GW P
WV 8W-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304734340 17123 Federal GW P
WV 2W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734468 17123 Federal GW P
WV 8W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304734469 17123 Federal GW S
WV 8W-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304734564 17123 Federal GW JP
WV 14MU-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304735879 17123 Federal GW P
WV 13MU-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304736305 17123 Federal GW P
WV 3D-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304737923 17123 Federal GW OPS C
WV 14DML-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304737924 17123 Federal GW P
WV 15AML-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304737925 17123 Federal GW OPS C
WV 13DML-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304737926 17123 Federal GW P
WV 4DML-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304737927 17123 Federal GW P
WV 11AD-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304738049 17123 Federal GW P
WV 6-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304738663 17123 Federal GW P
WV 2ML-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304738664 Federal GW APD C
WV 16C-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304738737 17123 Federal GW P
WV 7BML-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304738970 Federal GW APD C
WV 7AML-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304739035 Federal GW APD C
WV 14BML-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304739036 Federal GW APD C
WV 14B-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304739037 Federal GW APD C
WV 4B-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304739038 Federal GW APD C
WV 13A-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304739039 17123 Federal GW P
WV 8D-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304739040 17123 Federal GW P
WV 4BD-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304739041 17123 Federal GW P
WV 7CML-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304739042 Federal GW APD C
WV 7BD-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304739044 17123 Federal GW P
WV 2CML-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304739155 Federal GW APD C
WV 13AD-8-8-22R(RIGSKID) 08 080S 220E 4304739321 17123 Federal GW P
WV 2B-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304740262 Federal GW APD C
WV 8D-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304740263 Federal GW APD C
WV 7A-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304740331 Federal GW APD C

Bonds: BLM = ESBOOOO24
BIA= 956010693
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United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
TAKE PRioE'+4NCH p/ Utah State Office NAM ER ICA

P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

http://www.blm.gov/ut/st/en.html

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3100
(UT-922)

JUL 2 8 2010

Memorandum

Fr m:

1FrieldhOfEce,Price Fie ce Mo Fi

Subject: Name Change Recognized

Attached is a copy of the Certificate of Name Change issued by the Texas Secretary of State and
a decision letter recognizing the name change from the Eastern States Office. We have updated
our records to reflect the name change in the attached list of leases.

The name change from QuestarExploration and Production Company into QEP Energy
Company is effective June 8, 2010.

cc: MMS



FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEA-SOEDESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well WV 121

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEPENERGYCOMPANY 43047318730000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

2313 FSL 0653 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: . STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWSW Section: 14 Township: 08.05 Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE O ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

12/1/2011 O CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS O CONVERT WELL TYPE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

O OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

O PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL O TEMPORARY ABANDON

O TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE O WATER DISPOSAL

O DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

O WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP ENERGY COMPANY REQUESTS TO DEEPEN THE ABOVE WELL TO A DEPTH
OF 11,651' TO TEST THE MESAVERDE FORMATION. PLEASE SEE ATTACHED

DRILLING PLAN. THE PAPERWORK FOR SURFACE USE HAS BEEN SUBMITTED
TO THE BUREAU OF INDIAN AFFAIRS AND UTE ENERGY. þþ¾ ÌllO

UtahDivisionof

4 4 Yzž zz x
011,Gas and Mining

Action is Necessary

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Valyn Davis 435 781-4369 Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



QEP Energy Company
WV 121 Drilling Prog
API: 43-047-31873
Summarized Re-Entry Procedure

1. Clear location of all unnecessary equipment.
2. MIRU pulling unit.
3. ND tubinghead, NU BOP's (3M).
4. Kill well if necessary.
5. POOH with all existing production equipment and tubing.
6. Completions will prep well for re-entry.
7. POOH.
8. ND BOP's
9. RD pulling unit, move off location.
10. MIRU drilling rig.
11. NU rig's 5M BOPE.
12. Drill out shoe and downto 11,651'.
13. Log well. Triple or Quad-Combo (GR, NEU/DEN, IND, RES, SON)
14. RIH with 4-1/2" 11.6# HCP-110 casing and cement.
15. ND BOP's.
16.



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY
WV 121 (API#: 43-047-31873)

DRILLING PROGRAM

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approvalof Operations on Onshore

Federal Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil & Gas No. 1, and
the approved plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of its
subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to
insure compliance.

1. Formation Tops

The estimated top of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth, TVD & MD
Green River 2,165'
Mahogany 3,456'
Original TD 5,500'
Wasatch 6,054'
Mesaverde 9,071'
Sego 11,551'
TD 11,651'

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil, Gas, Water, and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top of the anticipated water, oil, gas, or other
mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered as follows:

Substance Formation Depth, TVD & MD
Gas Wasatch 6,054'
Gas Mesaverde 9,071'
Gas Sego 11,551'

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling
will be recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be
testedto determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal,
Utah. Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If flows are
detected, samples will be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses
conducted. Fresh water will be obtained from Wonsits Valley water right A36125

Page 1 of



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY
WV 121 (API#: 43-047-31873)

(which was filed on May 7, 1964) or Red Wash water right # 49-2153 (which was
filed on March 25, 1960). It was determined by the Fish and WildlifeService that
any water right number filed before 1989 is not depletingto the Upper Colorado
River System, to supply fresh water for drilling purposes. All water resulting
from drilling operations will be disposedof at Red Wash Central Battery Disposal
site; SWSE, Section 27, T7S, R23E or Wonsits Valley Disposal Site; SWNW,
Section 12, T8S, R21E.

3. Operator's Specification for Pressure Centrol Equipment

A. 7 1/16" or 11" as available 5000 psi double ram with blind rams and pipe
rams, annular preventer and drillingspool or BOP with 2 side outlets.

B. All BOP connections subject to pressure shall be flanged, welded or clamped.

C. Kill line (2" min), 2 choke line valves (3" min), choke line (3" min), 2 kill line
valves (2" min) and a check valve, 2 chokes with one remotely controlled
from rig floor and a pressure gauge on choke manifold.

D. Upper and Lower Kelly cock valves with handles and safety valve and subs to
fit all drill string connections.

E. IBOP or float sub available.

F. Fill up line must be installedabove the uppermost preventer.

G. Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved
stack working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 50 percent of internal
yield pressure of casing whichever is less. BOP and related equipment shall
meet the minimum requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 for
equipment and testing requirements, procedures, etc..., for a 5M system and
individual components shall be operable as designed.

4. Casing Design:

Hole Csg. Top Bottom Wt. Grade Thread Cond. Expected
Size Size (MD) (MD) MW(ppg)

12 1/4" 9 5/8" sfc 500' 36# J-55 STC Existing N/A
8 3/4" 7" sfc 5,498' 23# J-55 LTC Existing N/A
6 1/8" 4 1/2" sfc 11,651' 11.6# HCP-110 LTC New 8.8 -9.6

Page 2 of



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY
WV 121 (API#: 43-047-31873)

Casing Strengths: Collapse Burst Tensile (min)
9 5/8" 36# J-55 STC 2,020 psi 3,520 psi 394,000 lb.

7" 23# J-55 LTC 3,270 psi 4,360 psi 313,000 lb.
4 1/2" 11.6# HCP-110 LTC 8,830 psi 10,710 psi 279,000 lb.

Casing Design Factors
Burst: 1.2
Collapse: 1.2
Tension: 1.6

Maximum anticipated mud weight: 10.5 ppg
Maximum anticipated surface treatingpressure: 7,200 psi

5. Cementing Program

4-1/2" Production Casing:

Lead Slurry: 3,000' (TOC) - 9,071'. 220 sks (697 ft') Halliburton Extendacem,
3 pps Silicalite (extender), 1 pps Granulite TR ¼ (LCM), 0.125 pps Poly - E -

Flake. Slurry Weight 11.0 lb/gal, 3.18 ft3/sk, 0% excess

Tail Slurry: 9,071' - 11,651'. 180 sks (307 ft"), Halliburton Expandacem, 0.2%
Super CBL (Expander), 0.45% HR-5 (Retarder), 1 pps Granulite TR ¼, 0.125 pps
Poly-E-Flake (LCM). Slurry Weight 13.5 lb/gal, 1,71 ft*/sk, 25% excess over
gauge open hole.

*Final cement volumes to be calculated from caliper log and will attempt to pump
cement to 3,000'.

6. Auxiliary Equipment

A. Kelly Cock - yes

B. Float at the bit - yes

C. Monitoring equipment on the mud system- PVT/Flow Show

D. Full opening safety valve on the rig floor - yes

E. Drilling below the 7" casing will be done with water based mud.
Maximum anticipated mud weight is 10.5 ppg.

Page 3 of



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY
WV 121 (API#: 43-047-31873)

F. No minimum quantity of weight material will be required to be kept on
location.

G. Gas detector will be used from intermediate casing depthto TD.

7. Testing, logging and coring program

A. Cores - none.

B. DST - none anticipated

C. Logging - Mud logging - Intermediate Casing to TD
OH Logs: GR-SP-Induction, Neutron Density.

D. Formation and Completion Interval:
- Stimulation will be designed for the particular area of interest as
encountered.

8. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential
Hazards

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. Maximum anticipated
bottom hole pressure equals approximately 6,367 psi. Maximum anticipated
bottomhole temperatureis 210° F.

H2S has not been encountered in other wells drilled to similar depths in the
general area.

Page 4 of



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY
WV 121 (API#: 43-047-31873)
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ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY
WV 121(API#: 43-047-31873)
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UpdatedMPG6-23-2011
WV121

API#43-047-31873
NWSWSec 14TBSR21E

UintahCounty,Utah
KB4,870' 9-6/8"36#J-55
GL4,856' Set@500'

OriginalSpud9/30/1990

Perfs: TopofProductionCementat3,000'
TopofIntermediateCementat Unkown

6108- 5304

PlugBackTD@5,408'

A a OriginalTD@6,500'
7' 23#K-55@5,498'

6-118"OpenHole

TopofTeilemt@9,071'

4-1/2'HCP-110LTC



IK)¾KSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 07/07/2011 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-31873

WELL NAME: WV 121

OPERATOR: QEP ENERGY COMPANY ( N3700 ) PHONE NUMBER: 435-781-4369

CONTACT: VALYN DAVIS

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /

NWSW 14 080S 210E Tech Review Initials Date
SURFACE: 2313 FSL 0653 FWL

BOTTOM: 2313 FSL 0653 FWL Engineering

COUNTY: UINTAH Geology
LATITUDE: 40.12286 LONGITUDE: -109.52802

UTM SURF EASTINGS:625428 NORTHINGS: 4442222 Surface

FIELD NAME: WONSITS VALLEY ( 710 )

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal

LEASE NUMBER: U-0807 PROPOSED FORMATION: MVRD

SURFACE OWNER: 2 - Indian COALBED METHANE WELL? NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

Plat R649-2-3.

/" Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[]
Unit: WONSITS VALLEY (gl

(No. ESB000024 )

AL Potash (Y/N)
R649-3-2. General

Al Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

p/' Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception
No.49-2153 ) r

Drilling Unit
RDCC Review (Y/N)

Board Cause No:
(Date:

Eff Date:
Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting;

Intent to Commingle (Y/N) R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:

STIPULATIONS:
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State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER

GARY R.HERBERT Executive Director

covernor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GREGORY S. BELL JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Governor Division Director

July 12, 2011

QEP Energy Company
11002 East 17500 South
Vernal, UT 84078

Subject: WV 121 Well, 2313' FSL, 653' FWL, NW SW, Sec. 14, T. 8 South, R. 21 East,
Uintah County, Utah

Ladies and Gentlemen:

Pursuant to Utah Code Ann.§40-6-1 et seq., and Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et
seq., the Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining issues conditions of approval, and permit to drill
the listed well. This permit is issued in accordance with the requirements of Cause: 187-06. The
expected producing formation or pool is the Mesaverde Formation(s), completion into any other
zones will require filing a Sundry Notice (Form 9). Completion and commingling of more than
one pool will require approval in accordance with R649-3-22.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date.
The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-31873.

Sincerely,

John Ro s
Associate Director

JRbs
Enclosures

cc: Uintah County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal Office

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114 -5801

telephone (801) 538-5340 •facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • www.ogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS &



Operator: QEP Energy Company
Well Name & Number WV 121
API Number: 43-047-31873
Lease: UTU-0807

Location: NW SW Sec. 14 T. 8 South R. 21 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following
actions during drilling of this well:
• Within 24 hours following the spudding of the well - contact Carol Daniels at 801-

538-5284 (please let a voicemail message if not available)
OR
Submit an electronic sundry notice (pre-registration required) via the Utah Oil & Gas
website at http://oileas.ogm.utah.gov

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dustin Doucet at (801) 538-5281 office

(801) 733-0983 after office hours

3. Reporting Requirements
All reports, forms and submittals as required by the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation
General Rules will be promptly filed with the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, including
but not limited:
• Entity Action Form (Form 6) - due within 5 days of spudding the well
• Monthly Status Report (Form 9) - due by 5* day of the following calendar month
• Requests to Change Plans (Form 9) - due prior to implementation
• Written Notice of Emergency Changes (Form 9) - due within 5 days
• Notice of Operations Suspension or Resumption (Form 9) - due prior to implementation
• Report of Water Encountered (Form 7) - due within 30 days after completion
• Well Completion Report (Form 8) - due within 30 days after completion or plugging

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SEE ATTACHED

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6.NIF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNI1 or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° RED WASHdrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER SEE ATTACHED

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

QEP ENERGY COMPANY N/A
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONF NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
11002 E 17500 S crrY VERNAL STATE UT zi,84078 (435) 781-4331 RED WASH

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

5/3/2011 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP ENERGY COMPANY REQUESTS 12 MONTHS TA STATUS FOR THE LIST OF WELLS IN ORDER TO PERMIT AND
DEEPEN TO THE MESA VERDE FORMATION.

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED. COPYSENTTOOPERATOR

oate:AUG1 1 2011
Initialm Å$

NAME(PLEASEPR T JAN NELSON
TITLE PERMIT AGENT

SIGNATURE DATE 5/3/2011

(This space for St use only)

RECEIVED

(5/2000) ( e truct o eSe DIVOFOIL,GAS&



Unit # Lease# API number Well name Well # QTR SEC TWP RGE Future Plans for well bore
8910084820 UTUO807 4304731873 WV 121 NWSW 14 8S 21E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO81 4304715296 RW 12-148 SWNW 14 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO2030 4304715272 RW 12-208 SWNW 20 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO566 4304730311 RW 12-26B SWNW 26 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO933 4304730199 RW 13-27B NWSW 27 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO116 4304715258 RW 21-18B NENW 18 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO81 4304715186 RW 21-228 NENW 22 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO82 4304715167 RW 21-24B NENW 24 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO566 4304715191 RW 21-27B NENW 27 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO567 4304733522 RW 22-21B SENW 21 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO81 4304715153 RW 23-22B NESW 22 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO566 4304715290 RW 23-26B NESW 26 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO2030 4304715283 RW 31-28B NWNE 28 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO566 4304715275 RW 32-268 SWNE 26 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO558 4304715230 RW 32-28A SWNE 28 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO81 4304715152 RW 34-148 SWSE 14 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO82 4304731576 RW 42-23B SENE 23 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO82 4304715295 RW 43-24B NESE 24 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO566 4304730259 RW 43-26B NESE 26 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO2030 4304716475 RW 43-28B NESE 28 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO566 4304731053 RW 44-27B SESE 27 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO81 4304716495 RW 41-158 NENE 15 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO2148 4304730309 RW 14-18C SWSW 18 7S 24E Working on permits to deepen to MV in



RECEIVED: Feb. 15, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-0807 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 WONSITS VALLEY 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 WV 121 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047318730000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 WONSITS VALLEY 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2313 FSL 0653 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSW Section: 14 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

2 /15 /2012

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  CONFIDENTIAL

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 QEP ENERGY COMPANY REQUESTS THIS WELL BE FILED AS
"CONFIDENTIAL". 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Valyn Davis 435 781-4369

TITLE
 Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 2 /15 /2012

February 21, 2012

Sundry Number: 23125 API Well Number: 43047318730000Sundry Number: 23125 API Well Number: 43047318730000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING u_ogey

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well WV 121

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047318730000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext WONSITSVALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

2313 FSL 0653 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWSW Section: 14 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

2/15/2012
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: CONFIDENTIAL

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP ENERGYCOMPANYREQUESTS THIS WELLBE FILEDAS Accepted by the
"CONFIDENTIAL". Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
February 21, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Valyn Davis 435 781-4369 Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 2/15/2012

RECEIVED: Feb. 15,



RECEIVED: Jul. 10, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-0807 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 WONSITS VALLEY 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 WV 121 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047318730000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 WONSITS VALLEY 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2313 FSL 0653 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSW Section: 14 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

7 /12 /2013

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 QEP ENERGY COMPANY HEREBY REQUESTS A ONE YEAR EXTENSION FOR
THE APD ON THE ABOVE CAPTIONED WELL. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Valyn Davis 435 781-4369

TITLE
 Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 7 /10 /2012

July 11, 2012

Sundry Number: 27679 API Well Number: 43047318730000Sundry Number: 27679 API Well Number: 43047318730000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING U-0807

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well WV 121

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047318730000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext WONSITSVALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

2313 FSL 0653 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWSW Section: 14 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

7/12/2013
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENTREPORT DEEPEN FRACTURETREAT NEWCONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP ENERGYCOMPANYHEREBYREQUESTS A ONE YEAR EXTENSIONFOR Approved k>y the
THE APD ON THE ABOVE CAPTIONED WELL. Utah Division of

OFI, Gas and Mining

Date: July 11, 2012

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Valyn Davis 435 781-4369 Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 7/10/2012

RECEIVED: Jul. 10,



RECEIVED: Jul. 10, 2012

  

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

Request for Permit Extension Validation Well Number 43047318730000
 

API:  43047318730000
Well Name:  WV 121 

Location:  2313 FSL 0653 FWL QTR NWSW SEC 14 TWNP 080S RNG 210E MER S
Company Permit Issued to:  QEP ENERGY COMPANY

Date Original Permit Issued:  7 /12 /2011

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted above, hereby verifies that the
information as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require revision.
Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verified.

If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface agreement been updated?  
 Yes      No

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect the spacing or siting
requirements for this location?     Yes      No

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permitting or operation of this
proposed well?     Yes      No

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or rightof- way, which could affect the
proposed location?     Yes      No

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed?     Yes      No

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a change in
plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation?     Yes      No

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well?     Yes      No

        
Signature:  Valyn Davis Date: 7 /10 /2012

Title:  Regulatory Affairs Analyst Representing: QEP ENERGY COMPANY

Sundry Number: 27679 API Well Number: 43047318730000Sundry Number: 27679 API Well Number: 43047318730000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
'

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources
Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

OTI. EMI Pr N1NTrie

Request for Permit Extension Validation Well Number 43047318730000

API: 43047318730000
Well Name: WV 121

Location: 2313 FSL 0653 FWL QTR NWSW SEC 14 TWNP 080S RNG 210E MER S
Company Permit Issued to: QEP ENERGY COMPANY

Date Original Permit Issued: 7/12/2011

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted above, hereby verifies that the
information as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require revision.
Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verified.

* If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface agreement been updated? O
Yes No

• Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect the spacing or siting
requirements for this location? O Yes No

• Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permitting or operation of this
proposed well? (_) Yes No

• Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or rightof- way, which could affect the
proposed location? O Yes i No

· Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? O Yes No

• Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a change in
plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation? Yes No

' Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? Yes No

Signature: Valyn Davis Date: 7/10/2012
Title: Regulatory Affairs Analyst Representing: QEP ENERGYCOMPANY

RECEIVED: Jul. 10,



RECEIVED: Aug. 29, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-0807 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 WONSITS VALLEY 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 WV 121 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047318730000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 WONSITS VALLEY 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2313 FSL 0653 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSW Section: 14 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

8 /24 /2012

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 THIS WELL COMMENCED PRODUCTION ON AUGUST 24, 2012 @ 5:00
p.m.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Valyn Davis 435 781-4369

TITLE
 Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 8 /29 /2012

August 30, 2012

Sundry Number: 29371 API Well Number: 43047318730000Sundry Number: 29371 API Well Number: 43047318730000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING u_ogey

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. WONSITS VALLEY

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well WV 121

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047318730000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext WONSITSVALLEY

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

2313 FSL 0653 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWSW Section: 14 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

8/24/2012
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

THIS WELL COMMENCED PRODUCTION ON AUGUST 24, 2012 @5:00 Accepted by the
p.m. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
August 30, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Valyn Davis 435 781-4369 Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 8/29/2012

RECEIVED: Aug. 29,



r i

STATE OF UTAH DED REPORT FORM 8
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES ight changes)

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING DESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTUO807

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
6. IFIND1AN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

1a. TYPE OF WELL: OIL GAS DRY OTHER 7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME
WELL WELL WONSITS VALLEY

b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

L
OR Z. EP-

N'RY
EFSFŸR.

OTHER WV 121
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

QEP ENERGY COMPANY 4304731873
3, ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WLDCAT

11002 E. 17500 S. CITY VERNAL STATE UT ZIP 84078 (435) 781-4369 WONSITS VALLEY
4. LOCATIONOF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

MERIDIAN
ATSURFACE: NWSW, 2313' FSL, 653' FWL NWSW 14 8S 21E
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVALREPORTED BELOW: NWSW, 2313' FSL, 653' FWL

12. COUNTY 13. STATE
AT TOTAL DEPTH: NWSW, 2313' FSL, 653' FWL UINTAH UTAH

14. DATE SPUDDED: 15. DATE T.D. REACHED: 16. DATE COMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL):

9/30/1990 10/9/1990 8/24/2012 ABANDONED READYTO PRODUCE 4870 KB
18. TOTAL DEPTH: MD 11,701 19. PLUG BACKT.D.: MD 20. IF MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS, HOW MANY? * 21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD

PLUG SET:
TVD 11.682 TVD TVD

22. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICALLOGS RUN (Submit copy of each) 23.

TRIPLE COMBO
WASWELLCORED? NO YES (Submitanalysis)

WAS DST RUN? NO YES (Submit report)

DIRECTIONALSURVEY? NO YES (Submit copy)

24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in well)

HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE WEIGHT (#lft.) TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) STAGEDŒMHENTER CNEOMEONFSACPKES
VO

UMRE
BL) CEMENT TOP ** AMOUNTPULLED

6.125 4.5 P-16 11.6 7,688 11,691 735 304

25. TUBING RECORD

SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

2.375 11,525
26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD

FORMATION NAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM (TVD) INTERVAL(ToplBot - MD) SIZE NO. HOLES PERFORATION STATUS

(A) MESA VERDE 9,946 11,554 9,946 11,554 .35 144 open Squeezed

(B) Open Squeezed

(C) Open Squeezed

(D) Open Squeezed

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNTANDTYPE OF MATERIAL

9946 - 11554 57 BBLS 15%HCL, 5916 BBLS SLICKWATER, 1280 SX 30/50 SAND

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

O ELECTRICALIMECHANICALLOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONALSURVEY PGW
SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGING AND CEMENT VERIFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER: OPS SUMMARY

RECEIVED
(5/2000) (CONTINUEDON BACK)

SEP2 7 2012
DN.0F OIL,GAS&



31. INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVALA (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:

8/24/2012 8/27/2012 24 RATES: 23 1,064 270 FLOWS
CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVlTY BTU- GAS GASIOIL RATlO 24 HR PRODUCTlON OIL- BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:

22/64 795 1,625 RATES: -+ 23 1,064 270
INTERVALB (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OlL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: ->

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU-GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

INTERVALC (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: -+

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU -GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: ->

INTERVAL D (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: -+

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU-GAS ASIOlL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: ->

32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

SOLD
33. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION(Log) MARKERS:

Show all important zones of porosityand contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushion used, timetool open, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Formation o o m Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (Measu
edpDepth)

GREEN RIVER 2,706
MAHOGANY 3,455
WASATCH 6,054
MESA VERDE 9,165
SEGO 11,565

35. ADDITIONALREMARK' (include plugg ng procedure)

#27: SQUEEZED PERFS FROM 5106'- 5114' W/ 2 SQUEEZE JOBS Wl135 SXS CLASS G.

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached Information is complete and correct as determined from all available records.

SNAME(PLEEASEP ND S TyreEE REGUOLA2TORYAFFAIRS ANALYST

This report must be submitted within 30 days of
a completing or plugging a new well • reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
• drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore • significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
• recompleting to a different producing formation e drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as cose samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from two or more formations.

**lTEM24: Cement Top -Show how reported top(s)of cement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL),cement bond log (CBL),temperaturesurvey (TS)).

Send to: Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801



QEP ENERGY Page 1 of 6

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: WVFU 121 (14-8S-21E)
Common Well Name: WVFU 121 (14-88-21E) Spud Date: 9/30/1990
Event Name: RE-ENTER Start: 6/2/2012 End: 6/5/2012
Contractor Name: KEY ENERGY Rig Release: 7/31/2003 Group:
Rig Name: KEY Rig Number: 955

Date From - To Hours Code Phase Description of Operations

7/25/2012 12:00 -06:00 18.00 LOC 4 RDMO RIG DOWN FLOOR TOPDRIVE, DRAIN MUD TANKS, RIG DOWN
GAS BUSTER LINES, SCOPE DOWN DERRlCK, GENERAL RIG
DOWN

7/26/2012 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 LOC 3 MIRU PJSM, RIG DOWN WITH TRUCKS ON RW-31-20B, MOVE RIG TO
WV121, SET INAND CENTER SUB, SET INALL EQUIPMENT, WORK
ON DERRICK BOARD AND INSPECT (ONE CRACKED
WELD--REPAIRED), RIG UP, RAISED DERICK @ 17:00 HR.S, RIG
UP LIGHTS FOR NIGHT CREW, (RIG MOVE WENT WELL, GOING
SLOW DUE TO NOT HAVING 3RD CREW (RIG UP CREW), ALSO
WASA LONGER MOVE--23 MILES)

18:00 -06:00 12.00 LOC 4 MIRU PJSM / JHA ON ALL MAJOR RIG UP PROJECTS, RIG UP WIRES
AND FIRE UP LIGHTPLANT, RIG UP TRACK AND TOP DRIVE, ALL
HYD LINES ON TOP DRIVE WERE REMOVED AND REPLACED IF
NEEDED, TAPED AND TIGHTENED. SET OUT SERVICE LOOP FOR
INSPECTION AND REPLACE IF NEEDED, LOAD FLOOR WITH 3
1/2" EQUlPMENTAND RIG UP, GENERAL RIG UP

7/27/2012 06:00 -02:00 20.00 LOC 4 MlRU RIG REPAIRS, MAINTANCEAND GENERAL RIG UP.
PJSM, JHA BEFORE EACH MAJOR PROJECT.
CHANGED DISCONECT ON DRAWORKS, CHANGE OIL /FILTERS
ON RIGHTANGLE DRIVE, CHANGE OILI FILTERS ON TOP DRIVE
AND TOP DRIVE POWER PACK, CHANGED PIG TAILON DRILLERS
CONSOL FOR TOP DRIVE, CHANGED PIG TAILON TOP DRIVE,
MAGNAFLEX QUILL/ (OK) AND CHECK END PLAY(OK), CHANGED
HYD FILTERS AND FLOW SENSOR ON TOP DRIVE POWER PACK,
REPLACED GAUGE ON STAND PIPE, CHANGED ALL 1 1/2" BALL
VALVESAND CONNECTIONS ON HYD LINES ON TOP DRIVE.
GENERAL RIG UP (HOOK UP FLARE LINES, GAS BUSTER, FILL
PITS, RIHUP FLOOR, PUMP THROUGH POP OFFS, RIG
INSPECTION)
TROUBLE SHOOT FROM 1600 TO 2200 LACK OF POWER /
CONTROL ON TOP DRIVE-- WIRE #31(TOP) HAS SHORT --

JUMPERED WIRE TO #25 (BOTTOM)
02:00 -06:00 4.00 BOP 1 DRLPRO PJSM / JHA, NIPPLE UP BOP, CHOKE AND ALL COMPONENTS,

CHANGE OUT 4.5" PIPE RAMS AND INSTALLED 2.875" TO 5"
VARIABLE RAMS, HOOK UP FLOOR KOOMY CONTROL AND
FUNCTION.
TESTERS AT 06:00

7/28/2012 06:00 - 15;00 9.00 BOP 2 DRLPRO PJSM/JHA TEST BOP-- TIW VALVE, IBOP AND LOWER KELLY
VALVE,PIPE AND BLIND RAMS, INNER AND OUTER CHOKE
VALVESAND CHOKE MANIFOLD 250 PSI LOW (10 MIN.), 5000 PSI
HI (10 MIN.), TESTED ANNULAR 250 PSI LOW (10 MIN.) 2500 PSI HI
(10 MIN.), (HAD TO RETIGHEN FLANGESON BOPE TWICE)

15:00 - 20:00 5.00 TRP 2 DRLPRO PJSM, PICK UP BHAAND TRIP IN HOLE WITH BUCKET TRUCK
TAGGED AT 4027'

20:00 - 20:30 0.50 CSG 1 DRLPRO PJSM, RIG DOWN BUCKET TRUCK
20:30 -21:30 1.00 RIG 6 DRLPRO PJSM, SLIP AND CUT 120' OD DRILLING LINE
21:30 -23:00 1.50 RIG 2 DRLPRO TOP DRIVE NOT WANTING TO TURN FORWARD, CHANGED OUT

ALL FUSE MODULES ON TOP DRIVE UNIT,WORKING GOOD
23:00 - 23:30 0.50 DRL 4 DRLPRO DRILL OUT BRIDGE PLUG AT 4027'
23:30 -00:00 0.50 TRP 2 DRLPRO TRIP IN HOLE FROM 4027 TO 5001'

TAGGED CEMENT AT 5001'
00:00 -03:30 3.50 DRL 4 DRLPRO DRILLCMENTFROM 5001' TO 5504'

292 GPM, 30 RPM, 106 DHRPM, 10/15 WOB.

Printed: 9/24/2012 10:38:27



QEP ENERGY Page 2 of 6

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: WVFU 121 (14-85-21E)
Common Well Name: WVFU 121 (14-88-21E) Spud Date: 9/30/1990
Event Name: RE-ENTER Start: 6/2/2012 End: 6/5/2012
Contractor Name: KEY ENERGY Rig Release: 7/31/2003 Group:
Rig Name: KEY Rig Number: 955

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Phase Description of Operations

7/28/2012 03:30 - 05:30 2.00 DRLPRO DRILLFROM 5504' TO 5707, ( 101/HR), 15-17K WOB, ROTARY 45
RPM, 130 DHRPM, 1850 OFF BOTTOMPSI AT 110 STKS, 350
DIFFERENTIAL, 325 GPM, 8.4#, 32 VIS

6.125" SEC FX55D, #11722794, 5-16s, 1.1781 TFA
HUNTING 7/8 LOBE, 2.6 STAGE, .26 RPG, STRAIGHT MOTOR

05:30-06:00 0.50 SUR 1 DRLPRO SURVEYSANDCONNECTIONS
7/29/2012 06:00 - 14:30 8.50 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILLFROM 5707' TO 6241, ( 62.82/HR), 12-15K WOB, ROTARY

45-55 RPM, 130 DHRPM, 1850 OFF BOTTOM PSI AT 110 STKS, 300
DIFFERENTIAL, 325 GPM, 8.4#, 36 VIS

14:30 - 15:00 0.50 RIG 1 DRLPRO RIG SERVICE, TOP DRIVE, LP, PP, DW #1 AND #2
15:00 - 17:30 2.50 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILLFROM 6241' TO 6432, ( 76.4/HR), 12-15K WOB, ROTARY

45-55 RPM, 130 DHRPM, 1850 OFF BOTTOM PSI AT 110 STKS, 300
DIFFERENTIAL, 325 GPM, 8.4#, 36 VIS

17:30 - 18:00 0.50 SUR 1 DRLPRO SURVEYS AND CONNECTIONS
18:00 -05:00 11.00 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILLFROM 6432' TO 7240, (73.45/HR), 12-18K WOB, ROTARY

55-65 RPM, 152 DHRPM, 2250 OFF BOTTOM PSI AT 115 STKS, 225
DIFFERENTIAL, 333 GPM, 8.7#, 38 VIS

05:00 -06:00 1.00 SUR 1 DRLPRO SURVEYS AND CONNECTIONS
7/30/2012 06:00 - 11:30 5.50 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILLFROM 7,240' TO 7,517, ( 50.36/HR), 12-18K WOB, ROTARY

55-65 RPM, 152 DHRPM, 2250 OFF BOTTOm PSI AT 115 STKS, 300
DIFFERENTIAL, 333 GPM, 8.8#, 37 VIS

11:30 - 12:00 0.50 RIG 1 DRLPRO SERVICE RIG, CHANGE LIGHT PLANTS, CHECK ALL EQUIPMENT
AND GREASE

12:00 - 13:30 1.50 RIG 2 DRLPRO AFTER RIG SERVICE WENT TO MAKE CONNECTION, TOP DRIVE
WOULDN'T TORQUE DRILL PIPE TO SPEC.S ONLY PUTTING OUT
1,000 PSI ON HYDRLIC GAUGE NEEDS TO BE 2,600, --- WOULDN'T
IN DRILLMODE NEITHER-- CHECK POWER PACK, DRILLER
CONSOLE, ON TOP DRIVE CHECKED PROPORTIONAL VALVES --

FOUND LOOSE WIRE IN WIRING BLOCK OF IT
13:30 - 17:30 4.00 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILLFROM 7,517' TO 7,777, ( 65/HR), 18-20K WOB, ROTARY

55-65 RPM, 152 DHRPM, 2250 OFF BOTTOm PSI AT 115 STKS, 300
DIFFERENTIAL, 333 GPM, 8.8#, 37 VIS

17:30 - 18:00 0.50 SUR 1 DRLPRO SURVEYS AND CONNECTIONS
18:00 - 05:00 11.00 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILLFROM 7,777' TO 8333, ( 50.54/HR), 14-20K WOB, ROTARY

55-65 RPM, 152 DHRPM, 2450 OFF BOTTOM PSI AT 117 STKS, 400
DIFFERENTIAL, 340 GPM, 9#, 37 VIS

05:00-06:00 1.00 SUR 1 DRLPRO SURVEYSANDREAMINGCONNECTIONS
7/31/2012 06:00 -08:00 2.00 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILLFROM 8,333' TO 8,408 ( 37.5 HR), 20K WOB, ROTARY 55-65

RPM, 152 DHRPM, 2450 OFF BOTTOM PSI AT 117 STKS, 400
DIFFERENTIAL, 340 GPM, 9#, 37 VIS

08:00 -08:30 0.50 RIG 1 DRLPRO SERVICE RIG, CHECK ALL EQUIPMENT AND GREASE
08:30 -17:30 9.00 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILLFROM 8,408' TO 8,854 ( 49.5 HR), 20K WOB, ROTARY 55-65

RPM, 152 DHRPM, 2450 OFF BOTTOM PSI AT 117 STKS, 400
DIFFERENTIAL, 340 GPM, 9#, 37 VIS

17:30 - 18:00 0.50 SUR 1 DRLPRO CONNECTIONS AND SURVEYS
18:00 -02:30 8.50 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILLFROM 8,854' TO 9,234 (42.22 HR), 20K WOB, ROTARY 55-65

RPM, 152 DHRPM, 2450 OFF BOTTOM PSI AT 117 STKS, 400
DIFFERENTIAL, 340 GPM, 9.1#, 37 VIS

02:30 -04:30 2.00 RIG 2 DRLPRO WASH PIPE PACKING WENT OUT
PJSM, PULLED 188' OFF BOTTOM, FIRST 80' WAS TIGHT.
INSTALLTIW AND CIRC SWEDGE AND CIRCULATE HOLE.
REPLACE WASH PIPE ANS PACKING, TEST

Printed: 9/24/2012



QEP ENERGY Page 3 of 6

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: WVFU 121 (14-88-21E)
Common Well Name: WVFU 121 (14-85-21E) Spud Date: 9/30/1990
Event Name: RE-ENTER Start: 6/2/2012 End: 6/5/2012
Contractor Name: KEY ENERGY Rig Release: 7/31/2003 Group:
Rig Name: KEY Rig Number: 955

Date From - To Hours Code e Phase Description of Operations

7/31/2012 02:30 -04:30 2.00 RIG 2 DRLPRO TRIP IN HOLE AND WASH LAST 90' TO BOTTOM.
04:30 -05:00 0.50 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILLFROM 9,234' TO 9,301 (60 HR), 20K WOB, ROTARY 55-65

RPM, 152 DHRPM, 2450 OFF BOTTOM PSI AT 117 STKS, 400
DIFFERENTIAL, 340 GPM, 9.1#, 37 VIS

05:00 -06:00 1.00 SUR 1 DRLPRO SURVEYS AND REAMING CONNECTIONS
8/1/2012 06:00 -09:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILL FROM 9,301' TO 9,429 (42.66 HR), 20K WOB, ROTARY 55-65

RPM, 152 DHRPM, 2450 OFF BOTTOM PSI AT 110 STKS, 400
DIFFERENTIAL, 330 GPM, 9.1+#, 37 VIS

09:00 -09:30 0.50 RIG 1 DRLPRO RIG SERVlCE, GREASE SWIVEL PACKING, CHECK ALL
EQUIPMENT

09:30 - 17:30 8.00 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILLFROM 9,429' TO 9,809 (47.5 HR), 20K WOB, ROTARY 55-65
RPM, 152 DHRPM, 2550 OFF BOTTOM PSI AT 100 STKS, 400
DIFFERENTIAL, 290 GPM, 9.5#, 41 VIS

17:30 -18:00 0.50 SUR 1 DRLPRO CONNECTIONS AND SURVEYS
18:00 -22:30 4.50 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILL FROM 9,809' TO 10,027 (48.4 HR), 20K WOB, ROTARY 55-65

RPM, 152 DHRPM, 2550 OFF BOTTOM PSI AT 100 STKS, 400
DIFFERENTIAL, 290 GPM, 10.0#, 39 VIS

22:30 -01:00 2.50 CIRC 1 DRLPRO #2 PUMP KEPT KlCKING OUT, WHEN TAGGING BOTTOM, TRIED 4
TIMES, CIRCULATE WITH #2 PUMP @ 162 GPM, WHILE
CHANGING OUT#1 PUMP LINERS TO 4 1/2"

01:00 -05:00 4.00 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILL FROM 10,027' TO 10,150 (32 HR), 22 KWOB, ROTARY 55-65
RPM, 152 DHRPM, 2350 OFF BOTTOM PSI AT 130 STKS, 300/500
DIFFERENTIAL, 250 GPM, 10.3#, 41 VIS / DRILLING WITH
8000/9000 UNITS GAS AND 5' FLARE

05:00-06:00 1.00 SUR 1 DRLPRO SURVEYSANDREAMINGCONNECTIONS
8/2/2012 06:00 -07:30 1.50 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILL FROM 10,050' TO 10,189 (26' HR), 22 K WOB, ROTARY

55-65 RPM, 152 DHRPM, 2350 OFF BOTTOM PSI AT 130 STKS,
300/500 DIFFERENTIAL, 250 GPM, 10.3#, 41 VlS / DRILLINGWITH
8000/9000 UNITS GAS AND 5' FLARE

07:30 - 08:30 1.00 CIRC 1 DRLPRO CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP FOR TRIP
08:30 - 14:00 5.50 TRP 10 DRLPRO TRIP OUT OF HOLE / CHANGE OUT BIT AND MOTOR
14:00 - 14:30 0.50 RIG 1 DRLPRO RIG SERVICE
14:30 -20:30 6.00 TRP 10 DRLPRO TRIP IN HOLE, FILL PIPE AT BHAAND ClRC BUAT 5609
20:30 -21:30 1.00 REAM 1 DRLPRO SAFETY WASH AND REAM FROM 10,128 TO 10,189 (20' FILL)
21:30 -02:00 4.50 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILL FROM 10,189' TO 10,444 (56.66HR), 15 K WOB, ROTARY 50

RPM, 117 DHRPM, 2,450 OFF BOTTOM PSI AT 130 STKS, 300/500
DIFFERENTIAL, 250 GPM, 10.4#, 38 VIS / DRILLING WITH
8000/9000 UNITS GAS AND 5' FLARE

02:00 -02:30 0.50 TRP 11 DRLPRO LAYDOWN DAMAGED DRILL PIPE
WASHED BOX

02:30 -05:00 2.50 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILL FROM 10,444' TO 10,620 (70.4HR), 15 K WOB, ROTARY 50
RPM, 117 DHRPM, 2,450 OFF BOTTOM PSI AT 130 STKS, 300/500
DIFFERENTIAL, 250 GPM, 10.4#, 38 VIS / DRILLING WITH
8000/9000 UNITS GAS AND 5' FLARE

ULTERA U613M / HUNTING 4.75" 7/8 LOBE, 2.6 STAGE, .26 RPG
05:00-06:00 1.00 SUR 1 DRLPRO SURVEYSANDREAMINGCONNECTIONS

8/3/2012 06:00 -13:00 7.00 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILL FROM 10,620' TO 11,016 (56.57HR), 15/17 K WOB, ROTARY
50 RPM, 117 DHRPM, 2,450 OFF BOTTOM PSI AT 130 STKS,
300/500 DIFFERENTIAL, 250 GPM, 10.4#, 38 VIS / DRILLINGWITH
8000/9000 UNITS GAS AND 5' FLARE

13:00 - 13:30 0.50 RIG 1 DRLPRO RIG AND TOP DRIVE SERVICE
13:30 -17:00 3.50 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILL FROM 11,016' TO 11,238 (63.42 HR), 15/17 K WOB, ROTARY

Printed: 9/24/2012 10:38:27



QEP ENERGY Page 4 of 6

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: WVFU 121 (14-88-21E)
Common Well Name: WVFU 121 (14-85-21E) Spud Date: 9/30/1990
Event Name: RE-ENTER Start: 6/2/2012 End: 6/5/2012
Contractor Name: KEY ENERGY Rig Release: 7/31/2003 Group:
Rig Name: KEY Rig Number: 955

Date From - To Hours Code Phase Description of Operations

8/3/2012 13:30 - 17:00 3.50 DRL 1 DRLPRO 55 RPM, DHRPM, 2,450 OFF BOTTOM PSI AT 125 STKS, 300/500
DIFFERENTIAL, 250 GPM, 10.7#, 38 VIS / DRILLING, MIXING LCM
PILLSAS NEEDED

17:00 - 18:00 1.00 SUR 1 DRLPRO SURVEYS AND CONNECTIONS
18:00 - 05:00 11.00 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILL FROM 11,238' TO 11,600 (30.18 HR), 18/22 K WOB, ROTARY

55 RPM, DHRPM, 2,450 OFF BOTTOM PSI AT 125 STKS, 200/300
DIFFERENTIAL, 250 GPM, 10.7#, 38 VIS I DRILLING, MIXING LCM
HOURLYAND PILLS AS NEEDED TO CONTROL SEEPING

DRILLING 50 FT HR FOR GAMALOGS FROM 11250 TOTD /
GEOLOGIST

05:00-06:00 1.00 SUR 1 DRLPRO SURVEYSANDCONNECTIONS
8/4/2012 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILL FROM 11,600' TO 11,701 (22.4 HR), 18/22 K WOB, ROTARY

55 RPM, DHRPM, 2,450 OFF BOTTOM PSI AT 125 STKS, 200/300
DIFFERENTIAL, 250 GPM, 10.7#, 38 VIS / DRILLING, MIXING LCM
HOURLY AND PILLSAS NEEDED TO CONTROL SEEPING

10:30 - 12:00 1.50 CIRC 5 DRLPRO CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP FOR SHORT TRIP
12:00 - 14:00 2.00 TRP 14 DRLPRO SHORT TRIP 26 STANDS (HOLE WAS CLEAN)
14:00 - 15:30 1.50 CIRC 1 DRLPRO CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP (HAD 15' FLARE WITH MAX 9131UNITS

OF GAS), SPOT WALNUT IN OPEN HOLE
15:30 - 18:30 3.00 TRP 2 DRLPRO TRlP OUT OF HOLE TO SHOE (HOLE WAS CLEAN)
18:30 - 19:30 1.00 ClRC 1 DRLPRO CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP @SHOE AND SPOT ECD SLUG TO LOG

HOLE
19:30 -00:00 4.50 TRP 2 DRLPRO DROP GYRO AND TRIP OUT OF HOLE
00:00 -01:00 1.00 TRP 1 DRLPRO LAYDOWN BHA, GYRO, AND MWD TOOLS

CLEAN FLOOR
01:00 -04:00 3.00 LOG 1 DRLPRO PJSM, JHA, RIG UP THRU BIT LOGGERS AND RUN TOOL IN HOLE

LOGS STOPPED AT 5912
LOG OUTAND RIG DOWN

04:00 -06:00 2.00 TRP 2 DRLPRO PJSM, JHA, MOVE DRILLCOLLARS AND WEIGHT PIPE IN
DERRICK.

PICK UP THRU BIT BHAAND TRIP IN HOLE DRIFTING EVERY
STAND.

8/5/2012 06:00 - 14:30 8.50 TRP 2 CSGPRO PJSM, JHA, TRIP IN HOLE WITH THRU BIT TOOLS ON DRILL
STRING TO LOG
DRIFT EVERY STAND

14:30 -15:30 1.00 TRP 2 CSGPRO PJSM, JHA, PICK UP SINGLES OFF CAT WALK TO BOTTOM AT
11,701'

15:30 -17:00 1.50 ClRC 1 CSGPRO CIRCULATE SWEEP AND CONDITION HOLE
17:00 - 19:00 2.00 LOG 3 CSGPRO PJSM, RIG UP THRU BIT LUBICATOR, LOG, CIRCULATE, RUN LOG

TOOL THROUGH DRILLPIPE AND SET. PULL LOG TOOL FREE,
SPOOL UP AND RIG DOWN TRHU BlT EQUIPMENT.

19:00 -02:00 7.00 LOG 2 CSGPRO PJSM, TRIP OUT OF HOLE WITH THRU BIT LOG TOOL IN PIPE AT 1
MIN PER 30 FT TO 5298'

02:00 -04:00 2.00 LOG 2 CSGPRO PJSM, JHA, RIG UP LOGGERS EQUIPMENT, RUN IN TO RETRIEVE
THRU BIT LOG TOOL, RIG DOWN

04:00 -05:00 1.00 TRP 2 CSGPRO FILL PIPE TO CLOSE FLOATSI PJSM, TRIP IN HOLE TO CIRC OUT
ECD PILL AT 6222'

05:00 -06:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CSGPRO CIRCULATE OUT ECD PILL
8/6/2012 06:00 -09:30 3.50 TRP 2 DRLPRO TRIP IN HOLE FROM SHOE AFTER LOGGING THRU BIT,TAGGED

@ 6,822-6,835 \ 8,873-8,884 \ 9,368-9,376
09:30 - 10:00 0.50 REAM 1 DRLPRO SAFETY WASH FROM 11,632 TO 11,701(10' FILL)
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: WVFU 121 (14-88-21E)
Common Well Name: WVFU 121 (14-88-21E) Spud Date: 9/30/1990
Event Name: RE-ENTER Start: 6/2/2012 End: 6/5/2012
Contractor Name: KEY ENERGY Rig Release: 7/31/2003 Group:
Rig Name: KEY Rig Number: 955

Date From - To Hours Code Phase Description of Operations

8/6/2012 10:00 -12:00 2.00 CIRC 1 DRLPRO CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UPAND SWEEP AROUND/ SPOT WAL-NUT
IN OPEN HOLE (RIG UP LAYDOWN MACHINE)

12:00 -16:00 4.00 TRP 3 DRLPRO LAYDOWN DRlLL PIPE FROM 11,701 TO lNSlDE CASING SHOE
5,450

16:00 -17:00 1.00 CIRC 1 DRLPRO CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UPAND SPOT ECD SLUG
17:00 -19:30 2.50 TRP 3 DRLPRO LAYDOWN DRILL PIPE FROM 5,450 TO 2,512
19:30 -20:30 1.00 TRP 2 DRLPRO TRIP BHA IN HOLE FROM THE DERRICK
20:30 -00:30 4.00 TRP 3 DRLPRO LAYDOWN BHAAND 2,500' DRILLPIPE
00:30 -02:30 2.00 CSG 1 DRLPRO PJSM, JHA, CHANGE OUT BAILS, INSTALLCRT, RIG UP CASUNG

CREW TO RUN 4 1/2" CASING
02:30 -04:00 1.50 CSG 2 DRLPRO MAKE UP FLOAT EQUIPMENT, TEST FLOATS AND TRIP IN HOLE,

FILL PIPE AT 500', 1000', 1500', 2000', 3000' AND CIRC AT 5526'
RUN 257 JTS OF 4 1/2" P-110 11.6# LT&CCASING AS FOLLOWS:
1 SHOE = 1.33
1 FLOAT SHOE =

.95

22 JTS = 1000.41
1 MARKER = 2.07
22 JTS = 1004.39
1 MARKER = 2.07
22 JTS = 1007.40
1 MARKER = 2.07
21 JTS = 966.13
1 MARKER = 2.07
170 JTS = 7702.41

04:00-04:30 0.50 CSG 2 DRLPRO CHANGEOUTCASINGTONGS/X3
04:30 - 06:00 1.50 CSG 2 DRLPRO CONTINUE RUNNIG CASING

8/7/2012 06:00 - 14:30 8.50 CSG 2 CSGPRO RUN 4 1/2 PRODUCTION CASING TO 11,691 CIRCULATE @5,562
BOTTOMS UP, 8,006 (1/2 BOTTOMS UP)
RAN CASING AS FOLLOWS:
1-SHOE= 1.33
1-FLOAT=

.95

22-JTS= 1000.41
1-MARKER=2.07
22-JTS= 1004.39
1-MARKER=2.07
22-JTS=1007.40
1-MARKER=2.07
21-JTS=966.13
1-MARKER=2.07
170-JTS=7702.41

14:30 - 16:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CSGPRO CIRCULATE CASING WHILE RIGGING DOWN CASERS AND
RIGGGING UP CEMENTERS HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE (PEAK GAS
8052 -15' FLARE),

16:00 -19:00 3.00 CMT 2 CSGPRO HOLD PRE JOB SAFETY MEETING, RIG UP HALLIBURTON, PUMP
CEMENTAS FOLLOWS: PRESSURE TEST LINES 5,000K, 10 BBL.S
WATER, 20 BBL.S 10.8# PPG SUPER FLUSH, 10 BBL.S WATER, 214
BBL.S (400 SX.S) 11#PPG, YlELD 2.95, 17.48 GAL SX, CEMENT
EXTENDA CEM , 90 BBL.S (335 SX.) 13# PPG YIELD 1.49, 6.99 GAL
SX, CEMENT EXPANDACEM, 30 BBL.S INTO TAILCEMENT LOST
RETURNS REDUCED PUMP RATE FROM 5 BBL.S TO 4 BBL.S STILL
NO RETURNS REDUCED RATE TO 3 BBL.S ... CLEAN LINES /
DROP PLUG (CEMENT AT HEAD WHEN DROPPING PLUG--WASN'T
U-TUBING) STATERED DISPLACING 2 BBL.S MIN. WHILE

Printed: 9/24/2012 10:38:27



QEP ENERGY Page 6 of 6

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: WVFU 121 (14-88-21E)
Common Well Name: WVFU 121 (14-85-21E) Spud Date: 9/30/1990
Event Name: RE-ENTER Start: 6/2/2012 End: 6/5/2012
Contractor Name: KEY ENERGY Rig Release: 7/31/2003 Group:
Rig Name: KEY Rig Number: 955

Date From - To Hours Code $" Phase Description of Operations

8/7/2012 16:00 - 19:00 3.00 CMT 2 CSGPRO WORKING CASING (CASING NOT FREE), PRESSURE INCREASING
SLOW LOOKING LIKE LIFT PRESSURE REACHED MAXIUM
PRESSURE 7,000 PSI KICK TRUCK OUT PRESSURE CLIMBED TO
7,500 PSI (BLED PRESSURE OFF) DIS-PLACED 94 BBL.S OF 2#
KCL WATER... TOTAL CALC. DISPLACMENT-181 BBL.S (TOTAL
BBL.S CEMENT LEFT IN CASING 87 BBL.S (5,58T)... RIG DOWN
CASERS... MONITOR WELL WELL STATIC (MUD IS AT FLOW LINE)

19:00 -22:00 3.00 BOP 1 CSGPRO NIPPLE DOWN BOPE EQUIPMENT (CLEAN MUD TANKS)
22:00 -22:30 0.50 CSG 7 CSGPRO SET CASING SLlPS ON 4 1/2 PROCTION CASING (110K SET IN

BOWL)
22:30 -00:00 1.50 BOP 1 CSGPRO SET BOPE BACK, FINISH NIPPLE DOWN AND CHAIN OFF BOP

RIG RELEASED AT MIDNIGHT 8/6/2012
00:00 -06:00 6.00 LOC 4 CSGPRO PJSM, JHA RIG DOWN TOP DRIVEAND TRACK

RIG DOWN FLOOR, PlTSAND PUMPS
READY RIG FOR MOVE
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