
FORK OGC-la susurr xx Tamunars•

THE STATE OF UTAH (Other i as on

DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES 5. I.-ASS DMiaNARION AND BABIAr. No.

DIVISION OF OIL & GAS CONSERVATION E-22652

APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLrDEEPEN,OR PLUGBACK INDIAN,AENRMORRIENAMR

1a. TTPs or wonE

DRILLG DEEPENO PLUG BACKO ' """ ^**"""""' **"

Ir. errnorwar.r. Natural Buttes Unit

är. O **.i.r. Œ ..... "JP Œ L'NS
8. FARM OR Ia5ASE NAME

2. NAME OF OPERA20E Natural Buttes Unit

CIG Exploration, Inc, s. war.r. no.

s. Anossamos ormno CIGE 80D-2-10-21

P. O. Box 749, Denver, Colorado 80201 to. rams.o ao roor., omwar.acar

4. =gx or war.a (x•oort locatsom etsarar saa ta annordanen wme state reuniremaat..•> Natural Buttes Unit

870 ' FNL/1018 ' FWL n. see.. w.,a.. x., on ar.s.
AND BURTET OL Amma

at prope..« prost sene
SAME Section 2-T10S-R21E

14. DisTANCE IN MILES AND DIBBCTIOl PROIR Naamamm2OWN OREOUT ORRICSA i COUNTT OS PARISE 18. STATE

Approximately 15 miles SE of Ouray, Utah Uintah Utah

15. DISTANCE PROM PROPOBRD* 18, NO. OW ACES 230 r.maça 17. NO. OW ACR-& ASSIGNED

LOCATIOW TO NBABBST
20 TRžg war.g.

PROPERTY OE ESABE UNr.» 870' 489.92 160
(Also to nearest drlga line, if anyl

18. DisTANCE raOR PaoPosso I.oCATIOx* 19. Paorossi DarTR 20. moTAar os CABLE TooLa

TO NEAREST WELL, DRILLING, CO5tPla5TED' 2363' 6200' Rot
omarruna rom.ox ruses.sas.,

ary

21. BERTATEDNa (Shome whether DE RT. GL etc.) 22. APPaoz. DARWwomE wtr.r. sTART*

5084' Ungr. Gr, January 15, 1981

PROPOSED CASING ANDsomrin TING PROGRAlt

asswornoLa azzmorcastas waxentraaroot- sarrrxensrTar quamettrorcáxame

12-1/4" 9-5/8" 36# 200' 125 sacks 4
8-3/4",7-7/8" 4-1/2" 11.6# 6200' Circulate cement back to surface

Fresh Water Aquifers will be protected when the long string is run and cement is circulated

back to surface.

Please see the following supplemental information:

(1) BOP Program APPROVEDBY THE DMSION O

(2) BOP Schematic OF OIL,GAS,gD MINING - y

(3) Survey Plat . / 3|/ DEC - 1980
(4) Cut & fill

Gas Well Production Hookup to follow Sundry Notice• DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS & MINING

IW AB&fW SPACE DESCRIBE PROSOSSER PROGRAW: If propose ietŒdeeper or plug beels give date on premst prodattive sene and proposetaar productive

sone. If proposaL is to drilt or deepen directionally, give pertinent data on subsurface locatione and measuret amLtraevertical depths. Give blowont

•·i·s·rr, Drilling Manager ,,,, December 29, 1980

(This space for rak or State oa-o -.30853

wmmasterwn
ausmowar na•mm

APPROVED By
VIT¶g DATE

CONDITIONS ORAPPROVAI., 17 ANT :

*SeeInseructionsOn Reverse
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PROJECT

C.l.G. EXPLORATION INC.
T/OS, R2/E, S.L.B.BM Well location , C/GE #$0-0-2-/0-21,

locoted os shown in the NWi/4 NWl/4
Section 2, TlOS, R21E, S.L.B. 8 M.

s 89°o6'W ., s 99*12' w Uintoh County, Utah.

266
87° (Moosured) 40. 73

¯o

¢/GE #80-0-2-/0-2/
lois' Elev. Ungraded Ground-5pg4

o o
X

X

e

CERTIFICATE

THIS IS TO CERTPFY THAT TNE ABOVE PLAT WAS PREPARED FROM

FIELD NOTES OF ACTuAL SURVEYS MADE BY RE OR UNDER MY

SUPEWVtSIOW AND THAT TNE SAME ARE TRut AND CORRECT TO TNE

BE$T OF MY KNOWLEDGE AND BELIEF,

R$$1STERED LANO SURVE
REGISTRAft0N NS 3(37
STATE OF UTAH

UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
SO. 66 R 0 SOX Q - 110 EAST - FIRST SOUTH

S 89c38' W ŸERNAt., UTAN - e4o7e
SCALE DATE

I" = 1000' 12 / 9 / 80

X = Section Corners Located PARTY REFERENCis
R¾ BK AC 6LO Plot

WEATHER ILE
Clear Coet els].XPl.9RATAGN
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BLOWOUTPREVENTER PROGRAM:

Operator's minimen specifications for pressure control equipment which is to be used,

a schematic diagram thereof showing sizes, pressure ratings, and testing precedures

and testing frequency.

Bottom: 3000# BOP W/4-1/" pipe rams
30000 BOP R/blind rams
3000# Hydril

Top: Grant rotating head

Manifold includes appropriate valves, positive and adjustable chokes and kill line,

to control abnormal pressures.

BOP's will be tested at installation and will be cycled on each trip.

The typa and characteristics of the proposed circulating medium to be employed for

rotary drilling and the quanities and types of mud and weighting material to be

maintained:

The well will be drilled with fresh water mud.from surface to 4500' with a weight of.

8.3 to 8.7 ppg. From 4500* to TD the well will be drilled with fresh

water mud with a veight from 8.7 to 10.4 PPS-

Anviliary equipment to be used:
' a. kelly cock

b. monitoring equipment on the mud system

c. a sub with a full opening valve will be available on the floor to stab

into the drill pipe when the kelly is not in the
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3000 psi psi Working Pressure BOPS

. ADJUSTABLE CHOKE

a a oAs
BUSTER

R-St.tNO RAM NYORAULICCNOKE
---> To MrPROM & GAS

PM R.- PIPE RAMS 4-1 BUSTER

KILLUNE
--> TO PETORILLING

. sPoot
.

TO Pt?
O GAS

CASING ---> BUSTER
SMOL

FROM
REMOTE

· LOCATIOlk

TO Pif.
1 8 GAS

BUsttR
POSITIVE CHOKE

Test Procedure

1) Flush 30P's and all lines to be tested with water.
2) Run test plug on test joint and seat in casing head (leave valve below

test plug open to check for leak).
3) Test the following to rated pressure:

a) inside blowout preventer
b) lower kelly cock

' c) upper kelly cock
d) stand pipe valve
e) lines to muk pump
f) kill line to BOP's

4) Close and test pipe rans to rated pressure.

5) Close and test Hydril to rated pressure.
6) Back off and leave test plug in place. Close and test blind rams to

rated pressure.
7) Test all choke manifold valves to rated pressure.

8) Test kill line valves to rated
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** FILE NOTATIONS**

DATE:

OPERATOR: fr'(\
WELLNO: jÛ
Location: Sec. T. 06 R. ... County:

File Ptepued: Entered on N.I .7:

CaAd Indexed: Complet¿on Sheet:

API Numbex " ' Û

CHECKEDBY:

Petroleum Engineer: ÑVf /- R - //

Director:

Administrative Aide:

APPROVALLETTER:

Bond Required: SuAvey Plat Requixed:

Oxder No. 0.K. Rule C-3

Rule C-3(el, TopogAaph¿c Except¿on - company owns o contAo a acAeage
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January 2, 1981

Denver, Colerado 80201

Re: Well No. CIGE
Sec. 2, T. 103, R. 21E
Uintah County, Utah

Insožar as this office is concerned, approval to drill the above
referred to gas well is hereby granted in accordance with Section 40-6-11,
Utah Code Annotated 1953, and predicated on Rule A-3, General Rules and
Regulations and Rules of Practice and Prodedure.

Should you determine that it will be necessary to plug and abandon
this well, you are hereby requested to immediately notify the following:

MICHAEL T. MINDER - Petroleum Engineer
Office: 533-5771
Home: 876-3001

Enclosed please find Form OGC-8-X, which is to be completed whether
or not water sands (acquifers) are encountered during drilling. Your
cooperation in completing this form will be appreciated.

Further, it is requested that this Division be notified within 24 hours
after drilling operations commence, and that the drilling contractor and rig
number be identified.

The API number assigned to this well is 43-047-30853.
.

Sincerely,

DIVlSION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

Michael T. Minder
Petroleum Engineer

/ko
cc: Donald Prince, State Land
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DIVISIONOFOILGASANDMINING

SPUDDINGINFORMATION

NAFEOFCOFFANY:CIG Exp. Inc.

son-2-io-21

SECTION 2 TOWNSHIP 108 RANGE21E COUNTY Inntah

DRIONGCMÐR Loffland Bros.

RIG# '

SPUDDED:DATF 2-2-81

IIMF 2:00 p.m.

}k»g air-driller (dry-hole)

DRILLINGWILLCQI?!ENCF 2

REPORTEDBY Paula (CIG)

TELEPHONE# Denver #

DATF 2-4-81 SIGNED
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F,;gmOGC-1b SUBM TRIPLICATE*

STATE OF UTAH (Otherinstructionson
reverse side)

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 8. Laassomasonassen ano amaras, no.

ML-22652
0. 17 INDIAN. ALLOTT-B OB TRIES NAMS

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
(De not use this form for ro sals to drill or to deepen or plus boek to a ditetent repervoir.

Use "AP CATION FOR PERMIT-" for sush propossis.) > N/A ·

A. 7. una seassamme name

as O ,'.'LL WEBB Natural Buttes Unit
& Nams or oramamos 6. raan oB LBASS NAMS

Camaral nil & Gas Corporation Natural Buttes Unit
3. Anossas oW 0958&208 0. WELL NO.

P. n. Enx 7 9. DenveTr Col orado 80201 CIGE 800-2-10-21
4. LOCATtom or wsLL rt toestion clearly anÃin aceordance witia any itate requirements.* 10. rtsLD AND POOL, 08 Wit.DCAT

See paet 17 )
le. 870' FNL / 1018' FWL (NWNW) Natural Buttes Unit

11. sac., T., a.. M., os aLE. Axe
saavat os Aa-A

Section 7-T1 71E
. PMBMW NO• 15. MESTATIONS ($$OW W OF. RT, GB. sta.) lŠ. COUNTT Og PAmtsiE STATS

43-047-30853 5084' Uner. Gr. Uintah Utah

"· ChecieAppropnete Bor ToindicateNatureof Notice,Report,or OtherData
NOTICE OWINTENWION 20: BUms-QUENT 887082 07:

TEST WATSB BRUT•OFF PULL 05 ALTER CASING WATBB SHUT•OPP REPAIRING WELL

PRACTURE TRBAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TEMATHENT ALTERING CAalNO

SHOOT OL ACIDESS ABANDON SBOOTING OR ACIDISING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANs (Other) OpeTSt OOß
(Nots : Report results of multiple completion on Wel
('immpletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. Dzacalas ranposso na cuarLETso oPsaATIONa (Clourly attte all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. It well is directionallr drilled, give subsurface locations and measured an& true vertical depths for all markers and senes perti-

nant to this work.) •

Well spudded February 2, 1981. Please see attached chronological for report of
operations from spud date through February 15, 1981.

1i 1 hproby t the ng is true and correet

BIG TITLa Drilling Manager vars February 19, 1981

(This space for Federal or State omee use)

APPROVED BT TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IP ANT:

*SeeInsiructionson Revesse
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ForynOGC-1b SUBMI' 3 TRIPLICATE*

TE OF UTAH (O
ms

)ns on

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGRATION AND SERIAL NO.

ML-22652

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
O P NDR Lm- O R

(Do not use this form for pronosals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a diferent reservoir.
Use "APPIACATION FOR PERMIT-" for sueh proposals.) N/A

i. 7. UNIT AGENEMENT NAME
OIL GAS m
war.r. U war.r. U otsan Natural Buttes Unit

2. NAMS OF OPSEATOR 8. FARM 08 LEASE NAME

nonstal Gil & Gas Corporation Natural Buttes Unit
8. AðDBBBS 09 OPSEAWOR 9. WELL NO.

P n. Ray 7/a nenver Col ora<1o 80201 GIGE 809-2-10-21
4. LOCATION OF WELL rt location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements? 10, essLa Axw'room, on wn.acar

See al o space 17 )"" 870' FNL / 1018' FWL (NWNW) Natural Buttes Field
11. ano., e., a., m., on as.s. aan

SURVET 08 ABBA

Section 2-T10S-R21E
14. Faxxzz No. 15. St.BVATIONs (Show whether or, ar, om, ete.) 13. couxer on paarom 1Š. stars

43-047-30853 5084' Uner. Gr· Ilintah ! Iltah
1e· ØsecleAppropnete BoxTo Indicate Natureof Notice,Report,or OtherDato

NOTICE OP INTENTION TO : SUBSEQUENT REPORT 07 :

TEST WATER BRUT•OFF PULL OR ALTER CA8tNO WATER SHUT•Orr REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDESS ABANDON* BHOOTING OR A€lDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANs (Other)
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on

Wel¯

(Other) PYnpnRefl Gas....Hell Prod . Hooku Q completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. omscarBE PROPOSED OR CUMPLETED OPERATIONs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. It well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti•
nent to this work.) •

SUPPLEMENTALTO APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

(1) Proposed Gas Well Production Hookup

A Typical Well Head Installation
B Typical Main Lines and Pipe Anchor Detail

(2) Proposed Pipeline Map Op

(3) Proposed Road and Flow Line and Pipeline Right of Wa //Qg

For On-Site Contact: Ira K. McClanahan at (303) 473-2300
,

NOTE: Well is presently being completed.

18. I hproby certify that the foregoing is true and correct

SIGNED TITLE Production Engineer DATE March 13, 1981

(This space for Federal or State omce use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAI4 IF ANY:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse
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Freehand sketch of location of proposed installation to be constructed or retired showing relative location of existing facilities in
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Statement for permit to lay flow line, to be included with application for
Drilling Permit:

Upon approval of all concerned regulatory agencies, CIG proposes to
install a surface flow line from CIGE #80D-2-10-21 in a northerly direction
through the NW/4 of Section 2 connecting to Line F196-4" in the NW/4 of
Section 2, all in 108-21E. The line will be approximately 200' long, as
shown on the attached sketches.

Pipe will be 2-3/8" O.D. x .125" W.T., Grade X-42 EW. It will be
butt-welded in place, using portable electric welding machines, and will be
laid aboveground except where burial is necessary for road crossing,
ditches, or other obstructions. Magnesium anodes will be installed at the
dehydrator, meter setting, road crossings, underground piping at stream
crossings, and at producer's separator for corrosion protection.

CIG will connect to producer's separator and install dehydration and
metering facilities within 100' of the connection.

Some damage will be incurred by trucks transporting pipe and welding
equipment over the pipeline route, but surface disturbance will be held to
a
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Forrn OGC-1b SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE*

TE OF UTAH (Otl tructions on

DEPARTMENWF NATURAL RESOURCES
side)

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING s. Laass ossronarson ano saalAL NO.

ML-22652

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON LL
$ F INDIAN, AMES O 88 NAME

(Do not use this form for prooosals to drill or to deepen or plut bio to a dite eservoir.
Use "APPIJCATION FOR PERMIT-" for su to osals.) N/A

A. 7. UNIT AGREBMENT NAME

WELL WELL OTHER Natural Buttes Unit
2. NAma or orsaatos 8. raan on r.aAsa xaus

Coastal 011 & Gas Corporation Natural Buttes Unit
8. ADDERES OF OPBB&TOR 9. WELL NO.

P. n. Roy 749. Denve Colorado 80201 CIGE 80D-2-10-21
4. LOCATION OP WELL (ROOÒrt100Bt10n 1Ëarlyand in accordance with any $tate requirements.• 10. PIBLD AND POOL, 08 WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)at surrae. 870' FNL / 1018' FWL (NW NW) Natural ßutteg Unit
11. SEC., T., B., M., OR BLE. AND

BURTET OR ABBA

Section ?-T1 R?lE
14. Paanto so. 15. al.svATIoNs (Show whether or, RT, om, ete.) 12. coCNTY 05 raassa sTATE

43-047-3003 5084' Ungr. Gr. Uintah Utah

te· CheckAppropnete BoxTo indicate Natureof Notice,Report,or ÕtherData
NOTICE OF INTENTION 20: SUmsmqCENT REPORT 07:

TBET WATBB BRUT-OPP PUI.L OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-Orr REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATitENT ALTERING CASING

BHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIEING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other) Operations X
(NoTs: Report results of multiple completion on Wel

(Other) Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIDE PROPOSED OR CUMPLETED OPERATIONs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled. sive subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this Work.) •

Please see attached for report of operations February 16, 1981 through March 15, 1981.

18. I hpreby eer that the to g is true and correct

SIGNED TITLE DTilling Manager DATa March 16, 1981

(Thi pace for Federal or State omce use)

APPROVED BT TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse
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PAGE 2

CIGE #80D-2-10-21 (CIGE)
Natural Buttes (E) LOCATION: 870' FNL & 1018' FWL

Uintah County, Utah NW NW, Sec 2-T10S-R21E.

AFE: 19816 WI: 100% Elv: 5080.61' GL, 5093,59' KB
ATD: 6000' SD: 2-2-81 TU: 6008
CIGE, Oper. PBTD• 5866'
Loffland, Contr.
9-5/8" @ 200' GL; 4½" @ 6008'; Perf: 4793-5846' (14 shots)

3-1-81 5385'; ( 318'-18½ hrs); Dr1g.
BGG 150 units, CG 325 units. Drlg Brk: 4786-4800', 200-275-200 units,

4-1-5"/ft. MW 9.4, vis 35, WL 14.8. Cum Cats: $159,487.

3-2-81 5657'; (299'-23½ hrs); Dr1g.
BGG 100 units, CG 180 units. Dr1g Brks: 5509-20' 100-365-150 units; 5576-86',

100-325-120 units; 5619-32' 100-200-100 units. MW 9.5, vis 39, WL 11.2. Cum Cats:

$167,727.

3-3-81 5959'; (302'-23¼ hrs); Dr1g.
BGG 90 units, CG 500 units. Drlb Brks: 5787-97' 100-275-100 units; 5828-

38' 90-350-100 units. MW9.8, vis 38, WL 10.2. (½° @ 5774'). Cum Cats: $175,949.

3-4-81 TD 6000'; (41'-3½ hrs); Logging w/Dresser.
Logger's TD 6009', SLM 6008'. MW 9.8, vis 43, WL 9.8. Cum Csts: $184,429.

3-5-81 TD 6008'; Cire 4½" esg @6008'; trip to emt.
MW 9.8, yty 43, WL 9.8. Cum Csts: $235,956.

3-6-81 TD 6008'; PBTD 5975'; RD RT.
Ran 49" esg to 6008'; est w/710 mm50/50 Poz, 8% gel, 10% salt (13.8#); disp1

w/5% KC1; 100 bb1 retn to surf; PD 8:10 AM 3-5-81. Rig rel 4:00 PM 3-5-81. Cum Csts:

$309,077.
3-7-81 TD 6008'; PBTD 5975'; RD RT.

Drop f/report; WO CD. Cum Cats: $314,227.

3-8-81 thru 3-12-81 WO CU.

3-131-81 TD 6008'; PBTD 5975' FC; Prep to perf.
Road to loc f/Vernal; MI RU Utah Well Service; ND tree, NU BOPs; set pmp,

flat tank & layed pmp line. Cum Cats: $2500.

3-14-81 TD.6008'; PBTD 5866'; Prep to brk dwn form w/5% KC1 wtr.

Road to loc f/Vernal; RU OWPto run GR-CCL; ran GR-CCL f/PBTD (5866') to

4600'; RD OWP; EU Western & press tstd esg to 6000 psi-held ok f/10 min; RD Western;

RU OWP & perf w/3-l/8" csg gun & 1 JSPF as follows: 4793, 4796, 4799, 5500, 5518,
5522, 5587, 5631, 5639, 5798, 5804, 5838, 5842, 5846' (14 shots); TIR w/2-3/8" 4.7#
J-55 tbg w/notched collar on ben & SN 1 jnt f/btm; 2-3/8" tbg hung @4612.78', SN @
4580,77'; had to kill well w/10 ppg brine wtr while running tbg; SDFN. Cum Csts:

$44,103.
3-15-81 TD 6008'; PBTD 5866'; F1w; well to pit to clean up after 5% KC1 wtr brk dwn.

Road to loc f/Vernal; WO Western; made 5 swb runs to swb out 10# brine wtr;

RU Western; brk dwn Wasatch form (perfs 4793-5846') w/2800 gal 5% KC1 wtr w/22 BS

distributed evenly thruout KC1 wtr; AP 5000#, AR 6 BPM; ISIP 1300#, 5 min 1000#, 10

min 900#, 15 min 900#; opnd well to pit on 16/64" CK; after 15 min, well flwg back LF

w/Tr gas, FTP 500#, SICP 1000#, 16/64" CK. Cum Csts: $48,053.

3-16-81 TD 6008'; PBTD 5866'; F1wg well to pit to clean up after 5% KC1 wtr brkdwn.

8:00 AM3-15-81, FTP 800#, SICP 475#, 16/64" CK, 1200 MCFD, 10-15 BWPD. Cum

Csts:
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CIGE #80D-2-10-21 (CIGE)
Natural Buttes LOCATION: 870' FNL & 1018' FNL

Uintah County, Utah NW NW, Sec 2-T10S-R21E.

AFE: 19816 WI: 100% Elv: 5084' GL (ungr); KB = 14'
ATD: 6000' SD: 2-2-81
CIGE, Oper.

TD: 6008'

Loffland, Contr.
PBTD: 5975'

9-5/8" @200' GL; 4½" @ 6008'

2-2-81 TD 200'; (200'-8 hrs).
Big Air Drl MI RU; Spud 12k" hole 2:00 PM 2-2-81; drl 200'.

2-5-81 TD 200'; WO RT.
Ran 5 jnts 9-5/8" esg 36# K-55 8rd ST&C 204'; landed @200' GL; Halliburton

emt 9-5/8" cag off 125 mm "H", 2% CaC1; circ 7 bbl of good emt to surf; PD 4:05 PM
2-5-81. Cum Csts: $26,595.

2-6-12-81 TD 200'; WO RT.

2-13-81 TD 200'; WO RT.

2-14-81 TD 200'; WO RT.

2-15-81 TD 200'; RU RT.
Cum Csts: $32,095.

2-16-81 TD 200'; RU RT.
Cum Csts: $37,245.

2-17-81 TD 200'; NU BOP & prep to tst.
Cum Cats: $43,280.

2-18-81 TD 200'; Rig rep.
Pull DW motor & sent to town f/rep; will not spud until inst. Cum Csts:

$59,373.

2-19-81 TD 200'; Rig rep, draw works motor.
Cum Csts: $65,048.

2-20-81 TD 200'; Re-dr1 mouse hole; rig rep.
Cum Csts: $70,373.

2-21-81 1201'; (987'-17 hrs); Dr1g.
MW 9.4, vis 27, circ pits. Cum Csts: $77,088.

2-22-81 1701'; (500'-11 hrs); WO est.
Lost circ @ 1601'; dry drill to 1701'; TIH OE to 1418'; emt w/250 sx C1 "H"

+ 2% CaC12. MW 8.4, vis 27, cire pit. Cum Csts: $87,130.

2-23-81 2270'; (569'-13 hrs); Drlg.
MW 8.4, vis 27. Cwn Cats: $101,050.

2-24-81 3126'; (856'-22½ hrs); Dr18.
KW 8.4, vis 27, circ pit. (1° @3000'). Cum Csts: $108,533.

2-25-81 3840'; (714'-23½ hrs); Drlg.
MW 8.5, vis 28, mudding up. BGG 165 units, CG 200 units. Cum Csts:

$115,858.

2-26-81 4350'; (510'-23 hrs); Dr1g.
BGG 450 units, CG 500 units. MW 8.6, vis 34, WL 13.2. (3/4° @ 3800').

Cum Csts: $123,618.

2-27-81 4687'; (337'-17 hrs); TIR w/bit #3.
BGG 200 units, CG 350 units. MW 9.0, vis 34, WL 18.

(½° @4687'). Cum

Csts: $134,382.

2-28-81 5040'; (353'-21½ hrs); Dr1g.
BGG400 units, CG 550 units. MW 9.1, vis 35, WL 16. Cum Csts:
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Form OGG 3
SUBNIT IN DUPLICATE*

STATE OF UTAH (Seeotherin-
structions on 5. LEASE DESIGNATION A"D BERIAL NO.

OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION
reverseside)

U I AOBEEMEN E

IBM NAME

b. TYPE OF COMPLETION:

\VELL WELL DRT Other

Nat t Unit
VEE

L
OWORK EP D FFá.

Other S. FARM 08 LEASE NAME

2. NAME OF OPERATOR Natu AgÇg Unit

CTO Exploration, Inc.
"

S & MINING
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOn C -2-10-21

P. O. Box 749, Denver, Colorado 80201 to. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance tofth any State requirements)• Natural Buttes Field
At surface 870 ' FNL / 1018 ' FWL (NW NW) 11. e rüR., M., OR BLOCK AND BURVEY

At top prod. interval reported below

Same
At total depth Section 2-T10S-R21E

14. PERMIT NO. DATE ISSUED 12.COUNTY OR 13. BTATE

Saine ranzas
43-047-30853 I 1-2-81 Uintah Utah

15. DATE SPUDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 1Î. DATE COMPL. (ÑOGdy $0 pf0d.) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, BT, GB, ETC.)o 19. ELET. CAalNGREAD

2-2-81 3-5-81 4-1-81 | 5084 ' Ungr . Gr . Unknown
20. TorAL DEPTH, MD & TTD 21. PLUO, BACK T.D., MD & TVD 22. IF MULT]PLE COMPL., 23. INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS

HOW MANT* DRILLED BT

6008' 5963' N/A 4 | 0-TD -----

24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(8), OF THIS COMPLETION--TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND TVD)* 25. WAS DIRECTIONAL
BURVET MADE

4793-5846' (Wasatch) Yes
20. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN 2Î. WAS WELL CORED

CASING RECORD (Report all strings se¢ in toell)

No

CASmo BIZE WEIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED

9-5/8" 36# 200' GL 12-1/4" 125 sacks ----

4-1/2" 11.6# 6008' 7-1/8" 1275 sacks ----

29. LINER RECORD 30. TUBING RECORD

81EE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT* SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER 88T (MD)

N/A - 2-3/8" 4613' -----

1. PERFORATION RECORD (Ìnterval,size and number) 82. ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEEE, ETC.

Perf w/3-l/4" esg gun w/1 SPF at: 4793', DEPTH INTERVAL (MD) AMOUNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL USED

4796', 4799', 5500', 5518', 5522', 5587', 4793'-5846' Acidize w/2800 gals 5% KC1 wtr.
5631', 5639', 5798', 5804', 5838', 5842" Frac w/90,000 bb1s gel + 180,000#
5846'. For a total of 14 holes. 20/40 sand.

33.* PRODUCTION
DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD (Flot0Ang, gGB liff, PUmping-8450 6%d igpe Of pgap) WELL STATUs (Producing or

$1 I Flowing S O Connection
DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SIEE PROD'N. FOR OIIr-BÉL. GAS-MCF. WATER-BEL. GAS-OIL BATIO

3-31-81 | 24 16/64" 0 650 0 ---

FIOW. TUBING PREBB. CASING PRESBURE CALCULATED OIL-BBL. GAS-MCP. WATER-BBL. OIL GRAVITT-API (CORR.)
24-Houa RATE

450 550 (SI) O 650 0 -------

34. DISPOSITION OF GAa (ßold, seed for fuel, vented, etc.) TEST WITNESSED BT

Vented K. E. Oden
35. LIST OF ATTACHMENTB

None
36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records

SIGNED * ' " ' TITLE Production Engineer DATE
April 8, 1981

*(SeeInstructionsand Spacesfor Additional Data on Reverse
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56 64 03
FILE IN TRIPLICATE
FORMOGC-8-X

STATEOF UTAH
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GASANDMINING

1588 West North Temple
Salt Lake City, Utah 84116 DViBIONOF

OlL, GAS & MiNING
*REPORTOF WATERENCOUNTEREDDURINGDRILLING*

«me 6 Ñumber CIGE 80D-2-10-21

Ûptr COA CIG Exploration, Inc. Aggggg¿ P. O. Box 749, Denver, Co. 80201

00464 COA Loffland Brothers Aditeha 410 17th Street, Denver, Co. 80202

Location a 4 m 4 Sec. 2 T. los R. 21E Countif Uintah

Water Sands

93]LË1 Volume qualit,y
From To Flow Rate or Head Fresh or Salty

1.

2 ,

NONE ENCOUNTERED

3.

4.

5.
(Lontinue of reverse side if necessary)

Foxmot¿on Topa
Green River - 1430'
Wasatch - 4667'

Remarks

NOTE: (a) Report on tA¿o goAm as pAov¿ded (ox ¿n Rufe C-20
, Genexat Rufes

and Regulat¿ona and Rules og Paaetice and P&oceduxe.

(b) Ig awater analysis has been made og the above Aeported zone,
please gouwaAd a copy along w¿th tk¿a
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COLORADOINTER$7ATE OAS COMPANY
G 4000•7/73

ELL Ti ST ,BATA FORM STATE COPY
ELD CODE FIELDNAME ÔP AA OPERATOR NAME WELL NAME

CODE
-Ji-I e4ATukAL 80TÝkasUT ¿2d Clu EXPLühAfluk IN C bou 2-10-21

ELL C
SECT TW RGE/SUR SEO OR

73 2 105 21E aASAftH ±A FLOW TLSI

OP N DATE (COMP.) OAIFICE METER RUN GRAVifY
FLOWW

ER E AL FLOWING SFAtle FLOWING STRING

MO DAY YR MO DAY Yg 812E SizE (SEP) PRESSURE ROOTS TEMP TEMP PRE TUBING CASING

1 12 13 - 14 15 · 10 17 - 10 19 - 2C21 - 25 23 27 28 32 33 36 39 - 42 43 - 48 49 51 52 5 - 61 0 67 08 73 74 76

XX XX XX XX XX XX XX XXX XX:XXX XXXXX X X XXX xxX XXXXX X XX XXXXX X K X

-OFF
SHUT-W TEST TO THE BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGETHEABOVE

T-IN) DATE C UB SLOPE EFF C E GR V Y
DATA IS CORRECT

MO DAY YR. M DAY YR. PSIO (PSIG

1 1 13-14 10-16 17 1 1 20 21-22 23 28 29 34 35 38 39 I I 45 I 50 --- 53 54 56 C

XX XX X XX XXX X xx x X xx x xxx E E
OfCitaTOFL.

5313 0 0

COLORADOINTER$7ATE OAS COMPANY
G 4000•7/73

ELL Ti ST ,BATA FORM STATE COPY
ELD CODE FIELDNAME ÔP AA OPERATOR NAME WELL NAME

CODE
-Ji-I e4ATukAL 80TÝkasUT ¿2d Clu EXPLühAfluk IN C bou 2-10-21
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OfCitaTOFL.

5313 0 0

COLORADOINTER$7ATE OAS COMPANY
G 4000•7/73

ELL Ti ST ,BATA FORM STATE COPY
ELD CODE FIELDNAME ÔP AA OPERATOR NAME WELL NAME
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-Ji-I e4ATukAL 80TÝkasUT ¿2d Clu EXPLühAfluk IN C bou 2-10-21

ELL C
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COLORADO INTERSTATE GAS COMPANY
is 4ees-ms

WELL TEST DATA FORM STAT Y
IELDCODE FIELDNAME ÔPEAAŸÔA OPERATOR NAME WELL NAME

CODE
01•11 ATURAL BUTT 22 LORATT

SECT TW RGEÌSUR SEO.
FOAMATION

3 2 1 S 21 ASATCH I ST 1
ELL ON FLOW TEST

(OPEN DATE (COMP) ORIFICE METER RUN COEFFICIENT GRAVITY METER DIFFERENTIAL METER C FLOWING STRING

M DA¥ MO. DAY YR SIZE SIZE (SEP.) RAN E PRESSURE ROOTS TEMP. TEMP PRESSURE PRESSURE TUBING CASING
t 12 13 - 14 15 16 17 10 9 - 20 11 - 2 23 27 28 32 33 38 39 -- 4$ 43 -- 4E 46 51 52 55 56 --- 68 59 - 61 62 67 68 73 74 74

XX XK XX X xX XX XXX XXXXX X X XXX XXX XXXXXIX XX xx XXX xxx Kxxxx xx XXX X X t

SLI.-OFF
SHUT-IN TEST TO THE BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE TH ABOVE

SHUT-IN) DATE CAdlNG TUBING SLOPE EFFECTIVE EFFECTIVE G AAVTY ES
DATA IS CORRECT

PREM PRESSURE DIAMETER LENGTH GAS) PRESS PRESS
10 DAY YR 10. DAY YR (PSI

12 1314 1516 1718 1920 2122 23 28 29 84 35 8Ag 1 4 60 53 54 65 i

X xx XX xx XX xx x Xx x xx xxx XXXXX x xxx E E r rn. rn

REMA

5373 0 0 50

COLORADO INTERSTATE GAS COMPANY
is 4ees-ms

WELL TEST DATA FORM STAT Y
IELDCODE FIELDNAME ÔPEAAŸÔA OPERATOR NAME WELL NAME

CODE
01•11 ATURAL BUTT 22 LORATT

SECT TW RGEÌSUR SEO.
FOAMATION

3 2 1 S 21 ASATCH I ST 1
ELL ON FLOW TEST

(OPEN DATE (COMP) ORIFICE METER RUN COEFFICIENT GRAVITY METER DIFFERENTIAL METER C FLOWING STRING
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SHUT-IN) DATE CAdlNG TUBING SLOPE EFFECTIVE EFFECTIVE G AAVTY ES
DATA IS CORRECT
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10 DAY YR 10. DAY YR (PSI

12 1314 1516 1718 1920 2122 23 28 29 84 35 8Ag 1 4 60 53 54 65 i

X xx XX xx XX xx x Xx x xx xxx XXXXX x xxx E E r rn. rn

REMA

5373 0 0 50

COLORADO INTERSTATE GAS COMPANY
is 4ees-ms

WELL TEST DATA FORM STAT Y
IELDCODE FIELDNAME ÔPEAAŸÔA OPERATOR NAME WELL NAME

CODE
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SECT TW RGEÌSUR SEO.
FOAMATION
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COLORADO INTERSTATE GAS COMPANY STATE COPY
JIG 896-7/73

WELL TEST DATA FORM
FIELOCODE FIELDNAME OPERATOR OPERATORNAME WELLNAME

-91-11 ÑÄTLÏRAL BUTIES UT CIG EXPLOAATT N ÍNC CIGE 800-2-10-21
WELLOODE LOCATION PANHANDLeinEDCAVE FORMATION3- 7 SECT TWNSHPABLKRGEISUR SEO NUMBER K-FACTOR
25373 2 105 21E ASATCH S FLOW TEST 1

WELLON FLOWTEST
(OPEN) DATE(COMP.) ORIFICE METERRUN COEFFICIENT GRAVITY MDETEFR METER DIFFERENTIAL METER FL WING SSGA/TIC FLOWINGSTRING

MO. DAY YR. MO. DAY YR. S SIZE (SEP.) RANGE PRESSURE ROOTS TEMP. TEMP HESSURE PRESSWTUBING CASING
11-12 13-14 15-16 17-18 19-20 21 22 23 27 28 32 33 38 39---42 43-45 46 51 52 55 56----58 59--61 62 07 68 73 74 75
XX XX XX XX kX XX XX XXX XX XXX XXXXX X X XXX XXX XXXXX X XX XX XXX XXX XXXXX X XXXXX X X X

WELLOFF
8HUT-INTEST TOTHEBESTOFMY KNOWLEDGETHEABOVE

(SHUTIN) PREASUNRE DATE CASING TUBING SLOPE EFFECTIVE EFFECTIVE a es DATA ISCORRECT.

11 2

11]A

15 6

17M

8 18 20 2

PRE GURE PRESURE

34 35 38 39

DIAMETER

11 45

I.ENGTH

19 50 53

PRESS PRESS

xx ×x x× xx ×× ××xxx x ×xxxx × x xx× x× ×××x ×××xx x ××× E E OPERATOR:

76 1 9950 4613 COMMISSION:
I I

COLORADO INTERSTATE GAS COMPANY STATE COPY
JIG 896-7/73

WELL TEST DATA FORM
FIELOCODE FIELDNAME OPERATOR OPERATORNAME WELLNAME

-91-11 ÑÄTLÏRAL BUTIES UT CIG EXPLOAATT N ÍNC CIGE 800-2-10-21
WELLOODE LOCATION PANHANDLeinEDCAVE FORMATION3- 7 SECT TWNSHPABLKRGEISUR SEO NUMBER K-FACTOR
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(OPEN) DATE(COMP.) ORIFICE METERRUN COEFFICIENT GRAVITY MDETEFR METER DIFFERENTIAL METER FL WING SSGA/TIC FLOWINGSTRING

MO. DAY YR. MO. DAY YR. S SIZE (SEP.) RANGE PRESSURE ROOTS TEMP. TEMP HESSURE PRESSWTUBING CASING
11-12 13-14 15-16 17-18 19-20 21 22 23 27 28 32 33 38 39---42 43-45 46 51 52 55 56----58 59--61 62 07 68 73 74 75
XX XX XX XX kX XX XX XXX XX XXX XXXXX X X XXX XXX XXXXX X XX XX XXX XXX XXXXX X XXXXX X X X

WELLOFF
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xx ×x x× xx ×× ××xxx x ×xxxx × x xx× x× ×××x ×××xx x ××× E E OPERATOR:

76 1 9950 4613 COMMISSION:
I I

COLORADO INTERSTATE GAS COMPANY STATE COPY
JIG 896-7/73

WELL TEST DATA FORM
FIELOCODE FIELDNAME OPERATOR OPERATORNAME WELLNAME

-91-11 ÑÄTLÏRAL BUTIES UT CIG EXPLOAATT N ÍNC CIGE 800-2-10-21
WELLOODE LOCATION PANHANDLeinEDCAVE FORMATION3- 7 SECT TWNSHPABLKRGEISUR SEO NUMBER K-FACTOR
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WELLON FLOWTEST
(OPEN) DATE(COMP.) ORIFICE METERRUN COEFFICIENT GRAVITY MDETEFR METER DIFFERENTIAL METER FL WING SSGA/TIC FLOWINGSTRING

MO. DAY YR. MO. DAY YR. S SIZE (SEP.) RANGE PRESSURE ROOTS TEMP. TEMP HESSURE PRESSWTUBING CASING
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I I



COLORADO INTERSTATE GAS COMPANY
CIG 4896-7/73

WELL TEST DATA FORM STATE COPY
IELDCODE FIELDNAME óÞEAATÖA OPERATOR NAME WELL NAME

CODE

WhLLcolik L PAmt i h/Itkt)UAVE FORMATION3 7 SECT. TW RGE/SUR SEQ. NUMBER K-FACTOR

WELL ON FLOW TEST
(OPEN) DATE (COMP.) ORIFICE METER RUN GRAVITY METER DIFFERENTIAL METER WELL ILuWIbie SI A l ic FLOWING STRING

MO. DAY YR. MO. DAY YR. SIZE SIZE COEFFICIENT (SEP.) RNE PRESSURE ROOTS TEMP. T
RGE SW.3

TUBING CASING
11 - 12 13 - 14 15 - 16 17 - 18 19 - 2 1 - 22 23 27 28 32 33 38 39 - 42 43 -- 45 40 51 52 55 50 - 58 59 - 61 62 67 68 73 74 75

XX XX XX XX XX XX XX XXX XX XXX XXXXX X X XXX XXX XXXXX X XX XX XXX XXX XXXXX X XXXXX X X X

WELL-OFF
SHUT-IN TEST TO THE BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE THE ABOVE

(SHUT-IN) PREAS E ATE CASING TUBING SLOPE ÆFFECTIVE EFFECTIVE G AA
BG DATA IS CORRECT.

PRESSURE PRESSURE DIAMETER LENGTH GAS) PRESS PRESS
MO. DAY YR. MO. DAY YR. (PN) EMI
11-12 13-14 16-16 17-18 19-20 1-22 23 28 29 34 35 38 39 44 45 19 50 --- 53 54 55 AIS

X X ( XX XX XX XX XXXXX X XXXXX X X XXX XX XXXX XXXXX X XXX E E nrrnavan

COLORADO INTERSTATE GAS COMPANY
CIG 4896-7/73

WELL TEST DATA FORM STATE COPY
IELDCODE FIELDNAME óÞEAATÖA OPERATOR NAME WELL NAME

CODE

WhLLcolik L PAmt i h/Itkt)UAVE FORMATION3 7 SECT. TW RGE/SUR SEQ. NUMBER K-FACTOR

WELL ON FLOW TEST
(OPEN) DATE (COMP.) ORIFICE METER RUN GRAVITY METER DIFFERENTIAL METER WELL ILuWIbie SI A l ic FLOWING STRING

MO. DAY YR. MO. DAY YR. SIZE SIZE COEFFICIENT (SEP.) RNE PRESSURE ROOTS TEMP. T
RGE SW.3

TUBING CASING
11 - 12 13 - 14 15 - 16 17 - 18 19 - 2 1 - 22 23 27 28 32 33 38 39 - 42 43 -- 45 40 51 52 55 50 - 58 59 - 61 62 67 68 73 74 75

XX XX XX XX XX XX XX XXX XX XXX XXXXX X X XXX XXX XXXXX X XX XX XXX XXX XXXXX X XXXXX X X X

WELL-OFF
SHUT-IN TEST TO THE BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE THE ABOVE

(SHUT-IN) PREAS E ATE CASING TUBING SLOPE ÆFFECTIVE EFFECTIVE G AA
BG DATA IS CORRECT.

PRESSURE PRESSURE DIAMETER LENGTH GAS) PRESS PRESS
MO. DAY YR. MO. DAY YR. (PN) EMI
11-12 13-14 16-16 17-18 19-20 1-22 23 28 29 34 35 38 39 44 45 19 50 --- 53 54 55 AIS

X X ( XX XX XX XX XXXXX X XXXXX X X XXX XX XXXX XXXXX X XXX E E
nrrnavan

COLORADO INTERSTATE GAS COMPANY
CIG 4896-7/73

WELL TEST DATA FORM STATE COPY
IELDCODE FIELDNAME óÞEAATÖA OPERATOR NAME WELL NAME

CODE

WhLLcolik L PAmt i h/Itkt)UAVE FORMATION3 7 SECT. TW RGE/SUR SEQ. NUMBER K-FACTOR

WELL ON FLOW TEST
(OPEN) DATE (COMP.) ORIFICE METER RUN GRAVITY METER DIFFERENTIAL METER WELL ILuWIbie SI A l ic FLOWING STRING

MO. DAY YR. MO. DAY YR. SIZE SIZE COEFFICIENT (SEP.) RNE PRESSURE ROOTS TEMP. T
RGE SW.3

TUBING CASING
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WELL-OFF
SHUT-IN TEST TO THE BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE THE ABOVE

(SHUT-IN) PREAS E ATE CASING TUBING SLOPE ÆFFECTIVE EFFECTIVE G AA
BG DATA IS CORRECT.

PRESSURE PRESSURE DIAMETER LENGTH GAS) PRESS PRESS
MO. DAY YR. MO. DAY YR. (PN) EMI
11-12 13-14 16-16 17-18 19-20 1-22 23 28 29 34 35 38 39 44 45 19 50 --- 53 54 55 AIS

X X ( XX XX XX XX XXXXX X XXXXX X X XXX XX XXXX XXXXX X XXX E E
nrrnavan



RATURALBUTTES UNIT
COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATED - OPERATED (COGC)

COLORADO INTERSTRIE GAS EXPLORATION - OPERATED (CIGE)

Natural Duck
COGC 1-22-9-20
COGC 2-22-9-20

Natural Buttes
COGC bmU (Ute Trail) #1W
COGC NBU (Ute Trail) #1MV
COGC NBU (Ute Trail) #7
COGC NBU (Ute Trail) #52X DIVISIONOF
COGC NBU (Ute Trail) #83X OL GAS&MINING
COGC NBU (Ute Trail) #88X

COGC NBU #1
COGC NBU #3
COGC NBU #4
COGC NBU #6
COGC NBU #7
COGC NBU #8
COGC NBU #9
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PROCEDURETO SHUT-0FF WATER

CIGE #80D
Natural Buttes Unit
Uintah County, Utah

WELLDATA

Location: 870' FNL& 1018' FWL,Section 2, T10S, R21E
Elevation: 5080' GL, 5093' KB
Total Depth: 6008'
PBTD: 5963'
Casing: 9-5/8" 36# K-55 CSA200', cmt w/125 sx

4-1/2M 11.6# N-80 CSA6008', cmt to surface
Tubing:2-3/8" 4.7# J-55 EUEset 9 4670'

Casing Properties:
Description ID Drift Capacity Burst Collapse

4-1/2" 11.6# N-80 4.000" 3.875" .0155 B/F 7780 psi 6350 psi
2-3/8" 4.7# K-55 1.995" 1.901" .00387 B/F 7700 psi 8100 psi

Perforations: 4793, 4796, 4799, 5500, 5518, 5522, 5587, 5631, 5639, 5798,
5804, 5838, 5842, 5846

PROCEDURE

1. MIRU service company. NDWH, NU BOP. TOHw/tubing.

2. RUwireline company. RIH w/CIBP on wireline. Set @5814'.

3. PU cmt retainer. TIH w/retainer on wireline. Set @5760'.

4. TIH w/tbg. Sting into retainer. Load backside with water if possible. RU service
company. Cmt squeeze perforations 5798'-5804' w/50 sxs Class "G" cmt w/water loss
additive (slurry volume 1.15 cu ft/sx). Unsting from retainer. Reverse out excess
cement. If no squeeze is obtained, clear perforations with water and resqueeze. Maximum
squeeze pressure is 1500 psi. TOHw/tubing.

5. WOC4 hours.

6. TIH w/bit and scraper. Drill out cmt retainer and cmt to 5810'. TOH.

7. TIH w/retrievable packer. Set packer 9 5760'. Pressure test squeezed perforations to
500 psi. Mill out CIBP. TOH.

8. TIH w/2-3/8" tbg. Return well to

PROCEDURETO SHUT-0FF WATER

CIGE #80D
Natural Buttes Unit
Uintah County, Utah

WELLDATA

Location: 870' FNL& 1018' FWL,Section 2, T10S, R21E
Elevation: 5080' GL, 5093' KB
Total Depth: 6008'
PBTD: 5963'
Casing: 9-5/8" 36# K-55 CSA200', cmt w/125 sx

4-1/2M 11.6# N-80 CSA6008', cmt to surface
Tubing:2-3/8" 4.7# J-55 EUEset 9 4670'

Casing Properties:
Description ID Drift Capacity Burst Collapse

4-1/2" 11.6# N-80 4.000" 3.875" .0155 B/F 7780 psi 6350 psi
2-3/8" 4.7# K-55 1.995" 1.901" .00387 B/F 7700 psi 8100 psi

Perforations: 4793, 4796, 4799, 5500, 5518, 5522, 5587, 5631, 5639, 5798,
5804, 5838, 5842, 5846

PROCEDURE

1. MIRU service company. NDWH, NU BOP. TOHw/tubing.

2. RUwireline company. RIH w/CIBP on wireline. Set @5814'.

3. PU cmt retainer. TIH w/retainer on wireline. Set @5760'.

4. TIH w/tbg. Sting into retainer. Load backside with water if possible. RU service
company. Cmt squeeze perforations 5798'-5804' w/50 sxs Class "G" cmt w/water loss
additive (slurry volume 1.15 cu ft/sx). Unsting from retainer. Reverse out excess
cement. If no squeeze is obtained, clear perforations with water and resqueeze. Maximum
squeeze pressure is 1500 psi. TOHw/tubing.

5. WOC4 hours.

6. TIH w/bit and scraper. Drill out cmt retainer and cmt to 5810'. TOH.

7. TIH w/retrievable packer. Set packer 9 5760'. Pressure test squeezed perforations to
500 psi. Mill out CIBP. TOH.

8. TIH w/2-3/8" tbg. Return well to

PROCEDURETO SHUT-0FF WATER

CIGE #80D
Natural Buttes Unit
Uintah County, Utah

WELLDATA

Location: 870' FNL& 1018' FWL,Section 2, T10S, R21E
Elevation: 5080' GL, 5093' KB
Total Depth: 6008'
PBTD: 5963'
Casing: 9-5/8" 36# K-55 CSA200', cmt w/125 sx

4-1/2M 11.6# N-80 CSA6008', cmt to surface
Tubing:2-3/8" 4.7# J-55 EUEset 9 4670'

Casing Properties:
Description ID Drift Capacity Burst Collapse

4-1/2" 11.6# N-80 4.000" 3.875" .0155 B/F 7780 psi 6350 psi
2-3/8" 4.7# K-55 1.995" 1.901" .00387 B/F 7700 psi 8100 psi

Perforations: 4793, 4796, 4799, 5500, 5518, 5522, 5587, 5631, 5639, 5798,
5804, 5838, 5842, 5846

PROCEDURE

1. MIRU service company. NDWH, NU BOP. TOHw/tubing.

2. RUwireline company. RIH w/CIBP on wireline. Set @5814'.

3. PU cmt retainer. TIH w/retainer on wireline. Set @5760'.

4. TIH w/tbg. Sting into retainer. Load backside with water if possible. RU service
company. Cmt squeeze perforations 5798'-5804' w/50 sxs Class "G" cmt w/water loss
additive (slurry volume 1.15 cu ft/sx). Unsting from retainer. Reverse out excess
cement. If no squeeze is obtained, clear perforations with water and resqueeze. Maximum
squeeze pressure is 1500 psi. TOHw/tubing.

5. WOC4 hours.

6. TIH w/bit and scraper. Drill out cmt retainer and cmt to 5810'. TOH.

7. TIH w/retrievable packer. Set packer 9 5760'. Pressure test squeezed perforations to
500 psi. Mill out CIBP. TOH.

8. TIH w/2-3/8" tbg. Return well to



cV¢r a:o
.sw'¢' u, 77ds, Æ2/E
/V/ 4Æ do., &74#

¿. .• Fog O'
B : X 93'

FS "..fd 57 f.5A Jod'
JA/7 »p//dd .sxx

/GNS - ¥75tr, *794, 4799, foo
.53rs29, dr22, 55297, ß¾3/

sus e, «z.wa, s a«o«, .= re.s s

FF 5A Adad
dAf r //75 .s:«

dAf7 7d JP£

cV¢r a:o
.sw'¢' u, 77ds, Æ2/E
/V/ 4Æ do., &74#

¿. .• Fog O'
B : X 93'

FS "..fd 57 f.5A Jod'
JA/7 »p//dd .sxx

/GNS - ¥75tr, *794, 4799, foo
.53rs29, dr22, 55297, ß¾3/

sus e, «z.wa, s a«o«, .= re.s s

FF 5A Adad
dAf r //75 .s:«

dAf7 7d JP£

cV¢r a:o
.sw'¢' u, 77ds, Æ2/E
/V/ 4Æ do., &74#

¿. .• Fog O'
B : X 93'

FS "..fd 57 f.5A Jod'
JA/7 »p//dd .sxx

/GNS - ¥75tr, *794, 4799, foo
.53rs29, dr22, 55297, ß¾3/

sus e, «z.wa, s a«o«, .= re.s s

FF 5A Adad
dAf r //75 .s:«

dAf7 7d JP£



Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
90 Budget smaanNo. 1004.4135aunel9 ) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires: Maleb31.1993

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. ta... o.sta.......a senaiNo.
ML-22652

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. Inndan.Anaaesor irdleNaum
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deeoen or reentry to a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals µ|A
7. If Unitor t A. Agree--- **

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE
p.. wen Natural Buttes Unit

8. Wen Nann and No.
am.or over.cor CIGE i SOD-2-10-21
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 9-^mw•uNo-

ddress sua Tel No 43-047-30853
P. O. Box 749, Denver, Colorado 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 10.FieldandPool.orExplosmoryAres

Locanon or wen wooms..Soc.. T.. R.. M.. or Smm Dewru- Natural Buttes
870' FNL & 1018' FWL (NWNW) it.commyorearna.s..

Section 2, T10S-R21E
Uintah County, Utah

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O son...n.... O --, O a.....< m...
O ............. O s.. c.........

sm Repen aussus No..no.n.. Frmamme

Oc a. . G w.., si..or
O s...--- s... O m.... O ca.......- w-

O on., O oi..... w....
(Nem Repenmemet makasines-smiseen Wee
Compimes er assememmenseenam a.esform.s

13. Descnos Proposen or Completes Operanons IClearty state au pertmem demis. and gavepomaamdates. mutudmg esun--idass or starang say propussa work. If wei e dusanomliy dadled.
give subsurface locanons ane mens-se and true verucal depuis for all markers and tones peranom to taas work.I*

Please see the attached chronological report for the clean out and water shut-off
procedure performed on the above-referenced well.

APR0 ô 199)
DIVISIONOF

OILGAS&MiNING

14. Is¡

Tide RegUlatory Analyst ,,,, Aprd 4, 1991
( space gor Federal or Stam orfics uses

..- or approws. af any:

TLde18 U.S.C. Secuan 4001. makesa a crime ior any pomm taowa¢y sat wdlially a makee any depi-nam er agiasy ei die Uaned Smas any leise, dcon-s er frandaism a-i-sam
or represemanons as aoany ma-r widia in pmedsedom.

•See instruotion on Reverse
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THE COASTALCORPORATION
PRODUCTIONREPORT

CHRONOLOGICALHISTORY

CIGE #800 (WATERSHUT-OFF) Page 4
NATURALBUTTESUNIT
UINTAHCOUNTY,UTAH
WI: 100.0% CIGE AFE: 18115

3/15/91 Rig up swab unit. Made 10 runs, recover 57 bb1s fluid. Well flowed
for 1 hr and then died. FFL 4100'. Made 16 swab runs. Recover 73
bb1s fluid.
DC: $1,050 TC: $29,028

3/16/91 Prep to swab. Swab 20 BW.
DC: $694 TC: $29,722

3/17/91 Swab 14 bbis wtr.
DC: 5660 TC: $30,382

3/18/91 Swab 15 bbls wtr.
DC: 5520 TC: $30,892

3/19/91 Swab 15 bb1s wtr.
DC: $510 TC: $31,402

3/20/91 Swab 10 bb1s wtr.
DC: $500 TC: $31,902

3/21/91 SI b1dg press. RD swab unit.

3/22/91 SI bldg press. SITP 750 psi, SICP 1050 psi.

3/23/91 SI b1dg press. SITP 600 psi, SICP 1275 psi.

3/24/91 Blow well for 15 min. SITP 600 psi, SICP 1275 psi.

3/25/91 Flwg 23 MCFD, 700 psi FTP, 8/64" choke.

3/26/91 Flwg 9 MCFD, low tbg pressure.

3/27/91 SI b1dg pressure.

3/28/91 SI b1dg pressure.

3/29/91 F1wg 12 MCFD,625 psi FTP.

3/30/91 No report.

3/31/91 F1wg 7 MCFD, 580 psi FTP. Production prior to water shut-off, 63
MCFD. Final
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THE COASTALCORPORATION
PRODUCTIONREPORT

CHRONOLOGICALHISTORY

CIGE #800 (WATERSHUT-0FF) Page 3
NATURALBUTTESUNIT
UINTAHCOUNTY,UTAH
WI: 100.0% CIGE AFE: 18115
TD: 6008' (WASATCH)
CSG: 4-1/2" 9 6008'
PERFS: 4793-5846'
CWC(M$):$15.0

2/28/91 Prep to set bridge plug. MIRUPool Well Service. Killed well with
85 bb1s 2% KC1. ND WH, NU BOP's. POOHw/tubing.
DC: $2,675 TC: $2,675

3/1/91 Prep to cmt squeeze perfs 5798' and 5804'. RUCutters Wireline. Set
BP @ 5814'. RDWireline. TIH w/Mountain States mech cmt retainer.
Set retainer 9 5682'.
DC: $3,897 TC: $6,572

3/2/91 Prep to mill out. RU Howco. Test tbg to 2000 psi. Test OK. Est
inj rate into perfs @5798' and 5804', 1/2 BPM9 1500 psi. Sting out
of retainer. Spot 12 bb1s Class "G" cmt 3 bb1s from E0T. Sting into
retainer. Squeeze 6 bb1s cmt into perfs. Locked up 9 1/4 BPM9 1500
psi. Sting out of retainer. Reverse 6 bb1s to pit. POOH.
OC: $6,806 TC: $13,378

3/3/91 Mill out cmt @ 5707'. No psi this a.m. TIH w/3-3/4" mill. Tagged
cmt 9 5679'. RU power swivel. Milled 3' to top of cmt retainer @
5682'. Milled out retainer and 25' cmt to 5707'. POOH. Mill worn
out.
DC: $3,400 TC: $16,778

3/4/91 Mill bridge plug. No psi this a.m. TIH w/mill. Tag cmt @ 5707'.
RU power swivel. Drill out 107' cmt. Tag BP @ 5814'. Circ well.
TIH w/pkr. Set pkr 9 5719'. Pressure test squeeze perfs to 500 psi
for 15 mins. Test OK. Test perfs above pkr, 4993' to 5639' (9
holes). Inject at 1 BPM9 1000 psi. POOH, LD pkr. PU mill. TIH.
DC: $4,500 TC: $21,278

3/5/91 TIH w/prod string. No psi this a.m. Mill on BP & 5814'. BP slipped
down and hung up & 5834'. Mill on plug. Pushed plug to PBTD @
5940'. LDtools.
DC: $2,900 TC: $24,178

3/6/91 Swabbing. No psi this a.m. TIH w/tbg. TSA 4679', SN O 4648'. Swab
110 BF. LTR 140 BF.
DC: $1,700 TC: $25,878

3/7/91 Swabbing. TP 40 psi this a.m. Made 10 swab runs. FL @ 4300'.
Recover 19 BF. LTR 121 BF.
DC: $1,250 TC: $27,128

3/8/91 RDMOSU. TP 150 psi this a.m. Made 16 runs. FL @4200'. Recover
22 BF. LTR 99 BF. Shut well in to build pressure.
DC: $850 TC: $27,978

3/9/91 SICP 250 psi, SITP 300 psi.

3/10/91 SICP 420 psi, SITP 425 psi.

3/11/91 SICP 400 psi, SITP 600 psi.

3/12/91 SICP 450 psi, SITP 650 psi.

3/13/91 SICP 500 psi, SITP 750 psi.

3/14/91 No
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PERFS: 4793-5846'
CWC(M$):$15.0

2/28/91 Prep to set bridge plug. MIRUPool Well Service. Killed well with
85 bb1s 2% KC1. ND WH, NU BOP's. POOHw/tubing.
DC: $2,675 TC: $2,675

3/1/91 Prep to cmt squeeze perfs 5798' and 5804'. RUCutters Wireline. Set
BP @ 5814'. RDWireline. TIH w/Mountain States mech cmt retainer.
Set retainer 9 5682'.
DC: $3,897 TC: $6,572

3/2/91 Prep to mill out. RU Howco. Test tbg to 2000 psi. Test OK. Est
inj rate into perfs @5798' and 5804', 1/2 BPM9 1500 psi. Sting out
of retainer. Spot 12 bb1s Class "G" cmt 3 bb1s from E0T. Sting into
retainer. Squeeze 6 bb1s cmt into perfs. Locked up 9 1/4 BPM9 1500
psi. Sting out of retainer. Reverse 6 bb1s to pit. POOH.
OC: $6,806 TC: $13,378

3/3/91 Mill out cmt @ 5707'. No psi this a.m. TIH w/3-3/4" mill. Tagged
cmt 9 5679'. RU power swivel. Milled 3' to top of cmt retainer @
5682'. Milled out retainer and 25' cmt to 5707'. POOH. Mill worn
out.
DC: $3,400 TC: $16,778

3/4/91 Mill bridge plug. No psi this a.m. TIH w/mill. Tag cmt @ 5707'.
RU power swivel. Drill out 107' cmt. Tag BP @ 5814'. Circ well.
TIH w/pkr. Set pkr 9 5719'. Pressure test squeeze perfs to 500 psi
for 15 mins. Test OK. Test perfs above pkr, 4993' to 5639' (9
holes). Inject at 1 BPM9 1000 psi. POOH, LD pkr. PU mill. TIH.
DC: $4,500 TC: $21,278

3/5/91 TIH w/prod string. No psi this a.m. Mill on BP & 5814'. BP slipped
down and hung up & 5834'. Mill on plug. Pushed plug to PBTD @
5940'. LDtools.
DC: $2,900 TC: $24,178

3/6/91 Swabbing. No psi this a.m. TIH w/tbg. TSA 4679', SN O 4648'. Swab
110 BF. LTR 140 BF.
DC: $1,700 TC: $25,878

3/7/91 Swabbing. TP 40 psi this a.m. Made 10 swab runs. FL @ 4300'.
Recover 19 BF. LTR 121 BF.
DC: $1,250 TC: $27,128

3/8/91 RDMOSU. TP 150 psi this a.m. Made 16 runs. FL @4200'. Recover
22 BF. LTR 99 BF. Shut well in to build pressure.
DC: $850 TC: $27,978

3/9/91 SICP 250 psi, SITP 300 psi.

3/10/91 SICP 420 psi, SITP 425 psi.

3/11/91 SICP 400 psi, SITP 600 psi.

3/12/91 SICP 450 psi, SITP 650 psi.

3/13/91 SICP 500 psi, SITP 750 psi.

3/14/91 No



THE COASTALCORPORATION
PRODUCTIONREPORT

CHRONOLOGICALHISTORY

CIGE #80D (CLEANOUT) Page 1
NATURALBUTTESUNIT
UINTAHCOUNTY,UTAH
WI: 100.0% CIGE
TD: 6008' (WASATCH)
CSG: 4-1/2" @ 6008'
PERFS: 4793-5846'
CWC(M$): $15.0

2/3/91 MIRU Pool rig #298. RU wireline unit. Pulled plunger lift
equipment. Tag sand fill 9 5694'. SDFN.
DC: $775 TC: $775

2/4/91 TIH w/sand bailer. Killed well. NU 80PE. POH w/tbg. PU sand
bailer. RIH. Cleaned out sand from 5691' to 5833'. POHw/empty
bailer.
DC: $4,600 TC: $5,375

2/5/91 Swabbing. TIH w/bailer and tubing. Cleaned out sand from 5833' to
5981'. TOOHw/bailer. Ran 148 jts tbg w/notched collar on btm and
a 10' blast joint on top. Landed notched collar 9 4670' and SN O
4639'. NDBOP & NU tree. Made 7 swab runs. Recovered 65 BW. Well
did not kick off.
DC: $2,500 TC: $7,875

2/6/91 Swabbing. SICP 400 psi, SITP 600 psi. Made 14 swab runs. Recovered
45 BW. Well did not kick off.
DC: $1,750 TC: $9,625

2/7/91 SI, b1dg pressure. SICP 950 psi, SITP 900 psi. Blew tbg down. Csg
pressure went to 0 psi. Made 3 swab runs. Recover 1 BW. Shut well
in. RDMOSU.
DC: $950 TC: $10,575

2/8/91 SI, b1dg pressure. SITP 950 psi, SICP 950 psi.

2/9/91 SI, b1dg pressure.

2/10/91 SI, b1dg pressure.

2/11/91 SI, b1dg pressure.

2/12/91 Attempt to unload well. Well frozen up.

2/13/91 F1wg 78 MCFD, FTP 600 psi, 16/64" choke.

2/14/91 F1wg 54 MCFD, FTP 700 psi, 16/64" choke.

2/15/91 F1wg 63 MCFD, FTP 500 psi, 16/64" choke. Final
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=orm o V OF UTAH
DEPAATMENT OF NATURAQAESOURCES e. Lease oessenanonand Serial Num0er
DIVISION OF OIL GAS AND MINING ML-22652

Indian Allottee or Triba Nama

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/Aa not use this form for proposais to drilinew wells deepen existing wens; or to reenter plugged and abandoned weits 8. Umt or Commututizauon Agreement
UseAPPtdCATIONFORPERMtT--forsucktproposals Natural Buttes Unit

ype of Weil
I 9. Well Name ana Numoer& D O °*••

CIGE #80D-2-10-21
2.NameatOperator

10. API Weil NumberCoastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-047-30853 Ÿ.tAddressotoperator 4. feieptioneNumber 11. Neid and Pact, or WildaatP.O. Box 749, Denver, Colorado 80201-0749 (303)573-4476 Natural Buttes5. Location of WeN

=ootage : 870 ' FNL & 1018 ' FWL countv : Uintahi oo.s.« T NWNW,Section P. TlnS-P?lF State : UTAH
oz. CHECKAPPROPRIATESOXES TO INDICATENATUREOFNOTlCE, REPQRT OR OTHER DATA

OTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT(Submit in Duplicate)
.

(Submit Original Form Only)
Abandonment New Construc:ion , Abandonment * , New ConstructionLJCasing Repair O Pull or ^iter cast"¤ O casingnepair OP ll or ^iter casingO cnanceor Pians O accomi• °" O changeof Pia a O 36 or or ^cietz.O Conversionto Injection g Shoot or Acidize O conversionto iniection O ventor mar.Fracture Treat O ventor mar• O Fractor. Treat O watersaut-on
Multipte Completion O watersnut-o" O Ot**
Other

Date of WoricCompletion
Approximate Date WoricWill Start 5-15-91

Aeport results of Muidpie Comptedans and Recampledone to different reservoirs
onWELLCOMPLErlON OR RECOMPt.ETIONANOLOG form.
• Must be accompanied by a cementverdicadon report.

la.DESCRISE PROPOSED OA COMPLETEDOPERATIONS(Clearly state all perdnent details, and give perdnent dates. Itwell is dkecdonally drilled, give subaurfacelocadonaand measured and true verdcal depthe for all markers and zones pertinent to this warit.)

Proposed Procedure:

1. MIRU service unit. NDWH,NUBOP. TOOHw/tbg.
2. RIH w/RBP on tbg. Set RBP 0 + 4900'. Raise tbg to 4800'.
3. Spot 10 bbls 7½°/sHCLacid down tbg. Follow w/20 bb1s produced water. Shut

4.

Te001H/tovernight teo alllow acid to soakR tuwellbore.to

production.

APPROVED BY THE ST

DATro LG

14. i hereby certify that ttle foregoing is true and corr t

sam.asignatur. Eileen Danni Dey Tw• Regulatory Analyst oate 4-10-91
(stateuse only)

(Bas!* See Instruodone an Aeueree
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Form 3i60-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
Budent Burean No. 1004.0135aune 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires: March31.1993

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. ta...oesas.......asen.tNo.
ML-22652

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. U Indan. Adoans or frdie Name
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deeoen or reentry to a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for suct: proposals N/A
7. If Umt or 1-A. Agresamm n•••

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE
Type or wen Natural Buttes Unit

n i Ollier 8. Wou Name ana No.
. Name at overa==r M i/80D-2-10-21

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 9. API wen No.

Address and Teicohone No. 43-047-30853
P. O. Box749, Denver, Colorado80201-0749 (303) 573-4476

to.Finisanaroot.orempio.maryAre.
4 Locauon ot Wed (Footage. icc.. T.. R.. M.. or Survev Descrianons i NatitTal Etiffes

870 ' FNL & 1018 ' FWL (NWNW) I1. cou..vor Pamn. sm.

Section 2, T10S-R21E
Uintah County, Utah

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Nonce or Intent U A e Omnas of Plans

O a......... O s. c........
Subseouent Repon Ruggmg M Non•Rounas Fracamag

O c.....,.., O w...s....
O a... -- s.... O an..., O c....... . -

odier Acid ize Q os,,,, «..,
Nois: Regenresensei inesideo----hemen WeH

COGigiMUS Or Rece-B-MUB ABUUN 858 Lag iOfM.0

13. Dcscrsos Pronossa or Comoisten Opersoom ICleativ sms att pamtiem demus. and gave parumm daœs. mcimbag estuna-o date or scalang any proposes warm. If wed a duecnomuy drdied.
gave subsurface tocauons and maamme saa una verucai depths for all maritars and soms pomaam to taas worg.s•

Please see the attached chronological report for the acid job performed on the above-
referenced well.

JUN0 6 1991
·

DiVISiONOF
LGAS&MINING

si nos Tine Regulatory Analyst 6-3-91

(Rus sp mr Federal or Stars office uses

Approved by Tide 05Candnunnaor appmum, at any:

TWe18 U.S.C. Secuan 4001. massa a a cuma ser any penom amowinglyana wdiibliy a mata e any depam-- er age-y at da Unma Sams any satse. iicamma er isamanism -
or reos•--- as e any mamr wid- - innamacena.

•See instruetion on Reverse
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THE COASTALCORPORATION
PRODUCTIONREPORT

CHRONOLOGICALHISTORY

CIGE #80D (ACIDIZE WELLBORE) Page 5
SECTION2-T10S-R21E
NATURALBUTTESUNIT
UINTAHCOUNTY,UTAH
WI: 100.0% CIGE AFE: 18143
TD: 6008' (WASATCH)
CSG: 4-1/2" @ 6008'
PERFS: 4793-5846'
CWC(MS):$15.0

4/21/91 POOHw/RBP and swab well in. MIRU Pool Well Service. POOHw/tbg.
PU RBP. TIH. Set RBP @4903'. POOHto 4810'. MIRUWestern. Spot
10 bb1s 7-1/2% acid across top perf. SOFN.
DC: $3,128 TC: $3,128

4/22/91 Swab well in. Open well. Well on vacuum. Release RBP @ 4903'.
POOHw/tbg and RBP. TIH w/2-3/8" tbg. Set tbg @4670'. NDBOP. NU
tree. RU swab. Swab well down.
DC: $3,150 TC: $6,278

4/23/91 RDMOCU. SICP 200 psi, SITP 150 psi. Swabbed well. Recovered 30
bb1s in 10 runs. FL 3000' to 4200'. Soaped well. RDMOCU.
DC: $1,250 TC: $6,558

4/24/91 SI bldg pressure. SITP 740 psi.
4/25/91 SITP 840 psi.
4/26/91 SITP 890 psi.
4/27/91 Blew well down to pit. Well died. SI b1dg pressure. SITP 50 psi.
4/28/91 SITP 940 psi.
4/29/91 SITP 980 psi.
4/30/91 Blew well down to pit. Flowed 1-1/2 hrs. SI b1dg pressure. SITP 0

psi.
5/1/91 SITP 950 psi.
5/2/91 SITP 1000 psi.
5/3/91 SITP 1025 psi.
5/4/91 Flow to sales line. 74 MCFD, 650 psi FTP, 8/64" choke.
5/5/91 Flowing 34 MCFD,650 psi FTP, 12/64" choke.
5/6/91 Flowing 23 MCFD,650 psi FTP, 12/64" choke.
5/7/91 Flowing 29 MCFD,550 psi FTP, 12/64" choke.
5/8/91 Flowing 22 MCFD,700 psi FTP, 12/64" choke.
5/9/91 Flowing 29 MCFD,650 psi FTP, 12/64" choke.
5/10/91 Flowing 32 MCFD,600 psi FTP, 12/64" choke.
5/11/91 Flowing 22 MCFD,700 psi FTP, 12/64" choke.
5/12/91 Flowing 32 MCFD, 500 psi FTP, 12/64" choke.
5/13/91 Flowing 29 MCFO,550 psi FTP, 12/64" choke.
5/14/91 Flowing 25 MCFD,600 psi FTP, 12/64" choke.
5/15/91 Flowing 29 MCFD,500 psi FTP, 12/64" choke.

Initial production: 0 MCFD. Final
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FORM a \TE OF UTAH
DIVISION OIL,GAS AND MINING

5. Lease Designation and Serial Number

ML-22652

6. IfIndian, Allottee or Tribe Name:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A

Do notuse thisform for proposals to drillnewwells, deepen existingwells, or to reenterplugged and abandoned wells 7. Unit Agreement Name:

Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLOR DEEPEN form for such proposals. Natural Buttes

1 Type ofWell: 8. Well Name and Number

OIL GAS OTHER: CIGE 80D-2-10-21

2 Name ofOperator: 9. AP1Well Number

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-047-30853

3 Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Natural Buttes

4 Location ofWell

Footages: 870' FNL & 1018' FWL County: Uintah

QQ, Sec., T., R., M.: NW/NW Section 2, T10S-R21E state: Utah

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit in Dupilcate) (Submit Original Form Only)

Abandon New Construction Abandon * New Construction

Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing

Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans Perforate

Convert to Injection Perforate Convert to Injection Vent or Flare

Fracture Treat or Acidize Vent or Flare Fracture Treat or Acidize Water Shut-Off

MultipleCompletion Water Shut-Off Other

Other Replace plunger, lower tubing

Date of work completion
Approximate date work willstart Upon approval Report results of bMultiple CompletionsÇand bRecompletionsÇto different reservoirsonWELL

COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measuredand true
vertical depths for allmarkersand zones pertinent to thiswork.)

Please see the attached procedure for operations to be completed on the subject well.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of \ 2 4

FORRECORDONLY

13.
Bonnie Carson

Name & Signature: Title Senior Environmental Analyst oate 03/21/97

(This space for State use ly)

(5/94) (See Instructions on Reverse
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CIGE #80D-2-10-21
NATURAL BUTTES FIELD
SECTION 2 T10S R21E
WORKOVER PROCEDURE µ¢

WELL DATA

LOCATION: 870' FNL 1018' FWL SEC. 2 T10S R21E
ELEVATION: 5084' GR., 5093' KB.
TD: 6008', PBTD 5963' (3/81)
CSG: 9-5/8", 36.0#, K-55 @ 200' w/ 125 SX.

4-1/2", 11.6#, N-80 @ 6008' w/ 1275 SX.
TBG: 2 3/8", 4.7#, J-55 @ 4670'
FORMATION(S): WASATCH 4793' - 5846', 14 HOLES (1981)

SQZD 5798' - 5804', 2 HOLES (1991)

PROCEDURE

1. MI & RU pulling unit. Blow down & kill well w/ 2 % KCL
water. ND WH. NU BOP.

2. PU & TIH w/ 2-3/8" tbg to verify PBTD. New BP will be
5639'. POOH w/ 2-3/8" tbg. NOTE: Plunger stuck in tbg @
SN. Exercise caution while pulling tbg.

3. RIH w/gauge ring to 5750'. POOH w/ gauge ring. PU & TIH
w/ CIBP. Set CIBP @ 5750' (new PBTD).

4. RIH w/2-3/8" tbg w/ notched collar on bottom. Land tbg @
5639'. ND BOP. NU WH. RD & MO pulling unit.

5. RU service company. Pump 357 gal. 15% HCL acid w/
inhibitors and clay stabilizers across perf's 4793' -

5639'. RD service company. Acid to soak 3 hrs. RU swab
unit. Swab/flow back acid.

6. Install PLE. Return the well to
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FQRA STS OF UTAH
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. Lease Designation and Serial Number

ML-22652
6. Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:

SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells,or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 7. Unit Agreement Name:

Use APPLICATIONFORPERMIT TO DRILLOR DEEPEN form for such purposes

Nattiral Bilttes
8. Well Name and Number:

1. Typeof Well: OIL GAS OTHER: CIGE 80D-2-10-21

2. Name of Operator 9 API Well Number:

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-047-30853
3. Address and Telephone Number. 10 Field and Pool, or Wildcat

P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Natural Buttes
4. Location of Well

Footages: 870' FNL& 1018' FWL County: Uintah
QQ.Sec., T., R., M.: NW/NWSection 2, T10S-R21E state: Utah

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT

(Submit In Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

O Abandon New Construction Abandon* New Construction

O a•Pair ca•ine O Pull or Alter Casing Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing

Change of Plans Recomplete Change of Plans Perforate

Convert to Injection Perforate Convert to Injection Vent or Flare

Fracture Treat or Acidize Vent or Flare Fracture Treat or Acidize Water Shut-Off

MultipleCompletion WaterShut-Off Other Set CIBP. Fish. Install PLE

O Other
Date of work completion 8/8/97

Approximate date work willstart Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETlON REPORT AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true
verticaldepths for all markers and zones pertinent tothiswork.)

Please see attached chronological well history for work performed on the subject well.

13 - ) 800018 CarSOn

Name &Signature / 4 Title Senior Envi ronmentã] Anal yst oate 3/13/98

(This space for te use only)

MAR16 1998

(5/94) (SeeInstructionsonReverseSide)
DIV.OFOIL,GAS&
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Name &Signature / 4 Title Senior Envi ronmentã] Anal yst oate 3/13/98

(This space for te use only)

MAR16 1998

(5/94) (SeeInstructionsonReverseSide)
DIV.OFOIL,GAS&

FQRA STS OF UTAH
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. Lease Designation and Serial Number

ML-22652
6. Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:

SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells,or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 7. Unit Agreement Name:

Use APPLICATIONFORPERMIT TO DRILLOR DEEPEN form for such purposes

Nattiral Bilttes
8. Well Name and Number:

1. Typeof Well: OIL GAS OTHER: CIGE 80D-2-10-21

2. Name of Operator 9 API Well Number:

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-047-30853
3. Address and Telephone Number. 10 Field and Pool, or Wildcat

P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Natural Buttes
4. Location of Well

Footages: 870' FNL& 1018' FWL County: Uintah
QQ.Sec., T., R., M.: NW/NWSection 2, T10S-R21E state: Utah

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT

(Submit In Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

O Abandon New Construction Abandon* New Construction

O a•Pair ca•ine O Pull or Alter Casing Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing

Change of Plans Recomplete Change of Plans Perforate

Convert to Injection Perforate Convert to Injection Vent or Flare

Fracture Treat or Acidize Vent or Flare Fracture Treat or Acidize Water Shut-Off

MultipleCompletion WaterShut-Off Other Set CIBP. Fish. Install PLE

O Other
Date of work completion 8/8/97

Approximate date work willstart Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETlON REPORT AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true
verticaldepths for all markers and zones pertinent tothiswork.)

Please see attached chronological well history for work performed on the subject well.
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CIGE #80D Page 4

Set CIBP, Fish, Install PLE

8/05/97 MIRU. SITP 275#, SICP 500#. Blow dwn well. ND tree, tight bolts "cut one". NU BOP.

RU. Pull hanger. PU 36jts tbg. No tag @5757'. POOH for esg scraper. PU mill & scraper

& RIH 77 stds. EOT 4775'. SDFN. TC: $4,133

8/06/97 Spot acid across perfs. SITP 300, SICP300. Kill well w/15 BBLs 2% KCl. RIH w/scraper

to 5758'. Broach tbg. POOH. PU CIBP & RIH, set CIBP @5750'. POOH. LD landing
tool. RIH w/NC 1jt, SN 181jts. Land @5638'. ND BOP. NU WH w/SN @5604'. Rack

out pmp & tank. SDFN. (9 prod perfs 4793-5639';,all other perfs under CIBP.)
TC: $9,129

8/07/97 Swb. RU. PT lines to 3190'. Pmp 20 BBLS 2% KCl, 500 gals 15%HCl w/clay stab & other
inhibitors. Displ w/22 BBLs 2% KC1. MIP 1200#@2.5 BPM. Left acid soak across perfs/6

hrs. Install PLE. RU Swb. Swb 60 BF/14 runs. IFL 2300', FFL 4500'. FTP 0, FCP 300 psi.
SDFN. TC: $16,816

8/08/97 Put on sales line. Swb 12 BF/5 runs. IFL 4700', FFL 5400'. SI for PBU. TC: $17,874

8/10/97 Unable to
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STAT FUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANOSERIALNUMBER:

A IF INDIAN ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLb

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significarilly deepen existing wells below current bollom-hole depttt. reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 6. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER

Exhibit "A"
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

58 Smith 1200 East cny Vernal STATEUtahzie84078 435-789-4433
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: COUNTY:

QTRIQTR. SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

n. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

CoMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECIAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER Name Chanee
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE- DIFFERENT FORMATION

12- DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depflis, volumes, etc.

As a result of the merger between The Coastal Corporation and a wholly owned

subsidary of El Paso Energy Corporation, the name of Coastal. Oil & Gas Corporation

has been changed to El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company effective March 9, 2001.

See Exhibit "A"

Bond # 400JUO708
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

NAME (PLEASE PRINT Ohn T TITLE Vice PreSident

SIGNATURE DATE '/ 'O

El Paso uction Oil & Gas Coñÿãñ
NAME(PLEASEPRIf ) ÃOhn T z er TITLE Vice PTOSident

SIGNATURE DATE '

(This space for ate use only RECEIVED
JUN 19 2001

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reversa Side)
DIVISION OF

OIL, GAS AND
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State of Delaware

Office of the Secretary of State
PAGE 1

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF

DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATTACHED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT

COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF ANENDMENT OF "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION", CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION" TO "EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY", FILED IN

THIS OFFICE ON THE NINTH DAY OF MARCH, A.D. 2001, AT 11 O'CLOCK

A.M.

RECEivED

DIVISION OF
DíL GAS AND MIN!NC

. Harriet Smith Windsor, Secutary of State

0610204 8100 AUTHENTICATION: 1061007

010162788 DATE:

State of Delaware
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03/09/01 10:14 FAX 713 420 4099 CORP. LAW DEPT. @003/003

CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT

OF

CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION (the "Company"), a corporationorganized and existing under and by virtue of the General Corporation Law of the State ofDelaware, DOES HEREBY CERT1FY:

FIRST: That the Board of Datetors of the Company, by the unanimouswñtten consent of its members, filed with the minutes of the Board, adopted a resolutionproposing and declaring advisable the fonowing amendment to the Certificate ofIncorporation of the Company:

RESOLVED that it is deemed advisable that the Certificate ofIncorporation of this Company be amended, and that said Certificate ofIncorporationbe so amended, by changing the Article thereof numbered"FIRST." so that, as amended, said Articleshall be and read as follows:

"FIRST. The name of the corporation is El Paso Production Oil & Gas
Company."

SECOND: That in lieu of a meeting and vote of stockholders, thestockholders entitled to vote hav©Siven unanimous written consent to said amendment inaccordance with the provisions of Section 228 of the General Corporation Law of theState of Delaware.

THIRD: That the aforesaidamendment was duly adopted in accordance withthe applicable provisions of Sections 242 and 228 of the General CorporationLaw of theState of Delaware.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, said COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATIONhas caused this certificate to be signed on its behalf by a Vice Presidentand attested by anAssistant Secretary, this 9th dayof March 2001.

COASTALOIL& GAS CORPORATION

David L. Siddall
Vice President

Attest:

STATE OF DELANARE
SECRETARY OF STATE

orvrsron or consonarronsM tE.Roark,Assi tSecret" NECElVEDoi.fian:f::°°2
!UN 19 2ÛÛl
DIVISIONOF

DIL GAS AND
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United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT -

Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155 JUL12 2001
DIVISIONOF

In Reply Refer To:
OIL, GAS AND MINING

3106
UTSL-065841
(UT-924)

JUL 1 0 2000

NOTICE

El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company : Oil and Gas
Nine Greenway Plaza :

Houston TX 77046-0095 :

Name Change Recognized

Acceptable evidence has been received in this office concerning the name change of Coastal Oil &
Gas Corporation into El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company with El Paso Production Oil & Gas
Companv being the surviving entity.

For our purposes, the name change is recognized effective March 9, 2001.

The oil and gas lease files identified on the enclosed exhibit have been noted as to the name change.
The exhibit was compiled from a list of leases obtained from our computer program. We have not
abstracted the lease files to determine if the entities affected by this name change hold an interest in
the leases identified nor have we attempted to identify leases where the entitities are the operator on
the ground maintaining no vested recorded title or operating rights interests. We will be notifying
the Minerals Management Service and all applicable Bureau of Land Management offices of the
change by a copy of this notice. If additional documentation for changes of operator are required by
our Field Offices, you will be contacted by them.

If you identify additional leases in which the entities maintain an interest, please contact this office
and we will appropriately document those files with a copy of this
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Due to the name change, the name of the principallobligor on the bond is required to be changed
from Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation to El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company. You may
accomplish this either by consent of surety rider on the original bond or a rider to the original bond.
The bonds are held in Wyoming and Colorado.

Opoloma L. Abeyta
Acting Chief, Branch of
Minerals Adjudication

Enclosure
1. Exhibit of Leases (1 pp)

cc: Moab Field Office
Vernal Field Office
MMS, Reference Data Branch, MS3130, PO Box 5860, Denver CO 80217

,\Attn: Jim Thompson (Ste. 1210), Box 145801, SLC UT 84114
Teresa Thompson (UT-922)
Joe Incardine
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The bonds are held in Wyoming and Colorado.

Opoloma L. Abeyta
Acting Chief, Branch of
Minerals Adjudication
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1. Exhibit of Leases (1 pp)
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accomplish this either by consent of surety rider on the original bond or a rider to the original bond.
The bonds are held in Wyoming and Colorado.

Opoloma L. Abeyta
Acting Chief, Branch of
Minerals Adjudication
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Exhibit of Leases

UTUSL-065841A UTU-47172 UTU-74415 UTU-53860
UTU-28652 UTU-50687 UTU-74416 UTU-66401
UTU-37943 UTU-52298 UTU-75091 UTU-67868
UTU-44089 UTU-0109054 UTU-75096 UTU-65389
UTU-44090A UTU-0143511 UTU-75097 UTU-77084
UTU-61263 UTU-0143512 UTU-75673 UTU-61430
UTU-00343 UTU-38401 UTU-76259 UTU-72633
UTU-02651 UTU-38411 UTU-76260 UTU-72650
UTU-02651B UTU-38418 UTU-76261 UTU-49692
UTU-0142175 UTU-38419 UTU-76493 UTU-57894
UTU-70235 UTU-38420 UTU-76495 UTU-76829
UTU-70406 UTU-38421 UTU-76503 UTU-76830
UTU-74954 UTU-38423 UTU-78228 UTU-76831
UTU-75132 UTU-38424 UTU-78714
UTU-75699 UTU-38425 UTU-78727
UTU-76242 UTU-38426 UTU-78734
UTU-78032 UTU-38427 UTU-79012
UTU-4377 UTU-38428 UTU-79011
UTU-4378 UTU-53861 UTU-71694
UTU-7386 UTU-58097 UTU-00576
UTU-8344A UTU-64376 UTU-00647
UTU-8345 UTU-65222 UTU-01470D
UTU-8347 UTU-65223 UTU-0136484
UTU-8621 UTU-66746 UTU-8344
UTU-14646 UTU-67178 UTU-8346
UTU-15855 UTU-67549 UTU-8648
UTU-25880 UTU-72028 UTU-28212
UTU-28213 UTU-72632 UTU-30289
UTU-29535 UTU-73009 UTU-31260
UTU-29797 UTU-73010 UTU-33433
UTU-31736 UTU-73013 UTU-34711
UTU-34350 UTU-73175 UTU-46699
UTU-34705 UTU-73434 UTU-78852
UTU-37116 UTU-73435 UTU-78853
UTU-37355 UTU-73444 UTU-78854
UTU-37573 UTU-73450 UTU-075939
UTU-38261 UTU-73900 UTU-0149767
UTU-39223 UTU-74409 UTU-2078
UTU-40729 UTU-74410 UTU-44426
UTU-40736 UTU-74413 UTU-49530
UTU-42469 UTU-74414
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH -KAS
2. CDW 5-LP
3. JLT 6-FILE

Enter date after each listed item is completed

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent

Operator Name Change (Only) X Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 3-09-2001

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY
Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 RM 2975B

HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995 HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995

Phone: 1-(713)-418-4635 Phone: 1-(832)-676-4721

Account NO230 Account N1845

CA No. Unit: NATURAL BUTTES

WELL(S)
API ENTITY SEC TWN LEASE WELL WELL

NAME NO NO RNG TYPE TYPE STATUS
NBU CIGE 79D-1-10-21 43-047-30896 2900 01-10S-21E STATE GW P
CIGE 107D-1-10-21 43-047-31747 2900 01-10S-21E STATE GW P
CIGE 205-1-10-21 43-047-32795 2900 01-10S-21E STATE GW P
CIGE 244-1-10-21 43-047-33209 2900 01-10S-21E STATE GW P
CIGE 245-1-10-21 43-047-33210 2900 01-10S-21E STATE GW P
UTE TRAIL U 88X-2G 43-047-15389 2900 02-10S-21E STATE GW P
NBU CIGE 18-2-10-21 43-047-30471 2900 02-10S-21E STATE GW P
NBU CIGE 80D-2-10-21 43-047-30853 2900 02-10S-21E STATE GW P
CIGE 100D-2-10-21 43-047-31731 2900 02-10S-21E STATE GW P
NBU 265 43-047-32796 2900 02-10S-21E STATE GW P
CIGE 224-2-10-21 43-047-32883 2900 02-10S-21E STATE GW P
CIGE 246-2-10-21 43-047-33687 99999 02-10S-21E STATE GW APD
CIGE 81D-4-10-21 43-047-30854 2900 04-10S-21E STATE GW S
CIGE 136-4-10-21 43-047-31979 2900 04-10S-21E STATE GW S
NBU 28 43-047-30305 2900 13-10S-21E STATE GW S
NBU 270 43-047-32862 2900 13-10S-21E STATE GW P
NBU 333 43-047-33641 2900 13-10S-21E STATE GW P
NBU CIGE 58-16-10-21 43-047-30532 2900 16-10S-21E STATE GW S
NBU 62 43-047-30909 2900 16-10S-21E STATE GW S
CIGE 140-16-10-21 43-047-31977 2900 16-10S-21E STATE GW P

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 06/19/2001

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 06/19/2001
3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 06/21/2001

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number:
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ROUTING
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2. CDW 5-LP
3. JLT 6-FILE

Enter date after each listed item is completed
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OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 06/19/2001

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 06/19/2001
3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 06/21/2001

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number:

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH -KAS
2. CDW 5-LP
3. JLT 6-FILE

Enter date after each listed item is completed

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent

Operator Name Change (Only) X Merger
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WELL(S)
API ENTITY SEC TWN LEASE WELL WELL
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OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 06/19/2001

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 06/19/2001
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4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number:



5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on: N/A

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: 07/10/2001

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator
for wells listed on: 07/10/2001

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,

for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 07/19/2001

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 07/19/2001

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: N/A

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: N/A

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: 400JUO705

FEDERAL BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond No: N/A

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on:

FILMING:
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on:

FILING:
1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:

COMMENTS: Master list of all wells involved in operator change from Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation to El Paso
Production Oil and Gas Company shall be retained in the "Operator Change

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on: N/A

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: 07/10/2001

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator
for wells listed on: 07/10/2001
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change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A
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The Division sent response by letter on: N/A
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of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on:

FILMING:
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1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:

COMMENTS: Master list of all wells involved in operator change from Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation to El Paso
Production Oil and Gas Company shall be retained in the "Operator Change
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for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A
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WESTPÔRT OIL AND GAS COMPANY, L.F.

410 Samtser*30eet M3W DenWr ColotadoingA456

.
'Iblephonel3W8755¾4 Feb 303 SFS5609

February1,2002

Depammatth.Insular
EmeanofLandManagement
2850Youngislå Stmet
Lakewood,CO80215-1093

.

Anantinn· Ids.)(mŠt MaxwtW

RE: BLMBand00.1203
BLMNadanwidhBand158626364
Smuty-on=9=l•·mlCasualtyCompany
BelooEnergyCorporadanmargaristo Weaport08 andGasCompany,Inc.
ConversianofWestpononandGascompany.Inn.,faloWesipon oftandosscompany,L1.
AssumptionRider- Westport onand GasCompany,L.P.

DearMs.Maxwen:

Passant to ouracent convasations, please Engmefonowinglist of unclesmesforthe BLM's .

eensideadnaand appsvat:

Twoo Assumpetenalders,fany execusesarisinals. ·

CopiesofSalso EnergyCospandenmargerintoWesiportOnandGasCómpany,Inc.
Copiesof WestpostOnandGasCompany,lae.,eenversioninto Westpon 08 and Gas
Campany,LS. .

ListofaBFedaal/BIA/StateLeases•Belon/Wesipat's leases-in eBstates.

Plasseinfannusofanyadditionalf..r-a- asededto completethechange to Westport08
andosscompany,L.P.,asopemorofaccord.

I thankyou for your assistanceandcoopemionin thismatter. Pleasedo aoshesitateoesteedng
ihe gn a shoulda quesden adse.

Sinnerely,
Wesiport 08 andGasCompany,L.P.

EnglaeerTechnialan
.

Enol: -
·
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Unite States Department of the In rior RECEIVED
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT EB2 2 2002

Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155 DIVISION OF

Salt Lake City,UT 84145-0155 OIL GAS AND MINING

In Reply Refer To:

3106
UTU-25566 et al
(UT-924)

FEB 2 1 2002

NOTICE

Westport Oil and Gas Company L.P. : Oil and Gas
410 Seventeenth Street, #2300
Denver Colorado 80215-7093 :

Name Change Recognized

Acceptable evidence has been received in this office concerning the name change of Westport Oil
and Gas Company, Inc. into Westport Oil and Gas Company, L.P. with Westport Oil and Gas
Company, L.P. being the surviving entity.

For our purposes, the name change is recognized effective December 31, 2001.

The oil and gas lease files identified have been noted as to the name change. The exhibit was
compiled from a list of leases obtained from our computer program. We have not abstracted the
lease files to determine if the entities affected by this name change hold an interest in the leases
identified nor have we attempted to identify leases where the entities are the operator on the ground
maintaining no vested recorded title or operating rights interests. We will be notifying the Minerals
Management Service and all applicable Bureau of Land Management offices of the change by a copy
of this notice. If additional documentation for changes of operator are required by our Field Offices,
you will be contacted by them.

If you identify additional leases in which the entities maintain an interest, please contact this office
and we will appropriately document those files with a copy of this
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Due to the name change, the name of the principallobligor on the bond is required to be changed
from Westport Oil and Gas Company, Inc. to Westport Oil and Gas Company, L.P.. You may
accomplish this either by consent of surety rider on the original bond or a rider to the original bond.
The bonds are held in Colorado.

UTU-03405
UTU-20895
UTU-25566
UTU-43156
UTU-49518
UTU-49519
UTU-49522
UTU-49523

obert Lo e
Chi f, Br c of
Minerals j dication

cc: Moab Field Office
Vernal Field Office
MMS, Reference Data Branch, MS3130, PO Box 5860, Denver CO 80217
State of Utah, DOGM, Attn: Jim Thompson (Ste. 1210), Box 145801, SLC UT 84114
Teresa Thompson (UT-922)
Joe Incardine
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UNITED STATES GOVERNMENT

memorandum
Branch of Real Estate Services

Uintah & Ouray Agency

oste: 5 December, 2002

Reply to
Attu of: Supervisory Petroleum Engineer

Subject: Modification of Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Regulations

To: Director, Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Division: John Baza

We have been advised of changes occurring with the operation of your database for
Change of Operator. You will be modifying your records to reflect Change of Operator
once you have received all necessary documentation from the companies involved, and
perhaps in advance of our Notice of Concurrence/Approval of Change of Operator where
Indian leases are involved.

We have no objection.

With further comment to Rulemaking, I wish to comment concerning the provision of
Exhibits for upcoming Hearings. I would like to see the Uintah & Ouray Agency, BIA,
and the Ute Indian Tribe, Energy & Mineral Resources Department added to the list of
those parties that receive advance Exhibits so as to allow us to have research time prior to
Hearing dates. We will be able to provide a more informed recommendation to the Oil,
Gas and Mining Board. It would be best if we would receive only those Exhibits that
concern Indian lands, specifically on or adjacent to Indian lands. This may be a difficult
situation to attain, as it is not always clear where 'on or adjacent' occurs.

I am aware thatyou have gone to extra effort to correct this matter already, and I fully
appreciate it. My request is intended only to allow the addition of Uintah & Ouray
Agency and Ute Indian Tribe to the official listing.

We appreciate you concern, and hope that these comments are timely enough for
consideration in the revision process.

CC: Minerals & Mining Section of RES
Ute Energy & Mineral Resources Department: Executive Director
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UnitedStatesDepartment of the Interior
BUREAU OF INDIANAFFAIRS

Wuhingte C 20240

FEB1 0 2003
RealEstateServices

CarrollA. Wilson
Principal Landman
WestportOil andGas Company,L.P.
1368South 1200Bast
Vemal,Utah 84078

DearMr.Wilson:

This is in responseto your toquest for approvalof RI1Insurance Company'sNationwideOil and
GasImaseBondNo.RLBOOOS239executedeffectiveDecember 17,2002,($150,000coverage)with
Westport OilandGas Company,L P., as principal.

Thisbondisherebyapprovedas of thedate of this correspondence and will be retained in theBureau
ofIndianAffairs'DivisionofRealEstateservices,1849CStreet,NW,MS-4512-MIB, Washington,
D.C.20240. All Bureauoi1and gas regional offices andthesuretyare beinginfortnedof thisaction.

In ca whereyouhaveexisting individual and/orcollectivebondson file with one ormoreofour
regionbloffices,you may now request those of¾ces,directly,to terminatein lieu of coverage under
this NationwideBond.

Enclosed is a copy of the approvedbondfor your files. If we maybe of furtherassistance in this
mquer, pleaseadvise.

Director,Officeof Tmst Responsibilities

Buclosure
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United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City,UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
UT-922

February 27, 2003

Westport Oiland Gas Company, L.P.
Attn: Gary D. Williamson
1670 Broadway, Suite 2800
Denver, Colorado 80202

Re: Natural Buttes Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

On February 27, 2003, we received an indenture dated December 17, 2002, whereby El Paso
Production Oil & Gas Company resigned as Unit Operator and Westport Oiland Gas Company,
L.P., was designated as Successor Unit Operator for the Natural Buttes Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effective February 27,
2003. In approving this designation, the Authorized Officerneither warrants nor certifies that the
designated party has obtained all required approval that would entitle it to conduct operations under
the Natural Buttes Unit Agreement.

Your nationwide(Colorado)oiland gas bond No. 1203 willbe used to cover alloperations withinthe
Natural Buttes Unit.

It is requested that you notify all interested parties of the change in unit operator. Copies of the
approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriate federal offices, with one copy returned
herewith.

Sincerely,

Is/ Robert A. Henricks

Robert A. Henricks
Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure

bcc: Field Manager - Vernal (wlenclosure)
SITLA
Division of Oil,Gas & Mining RECEIVED
Minerals Adjudication Group
File - Natural Buttes Unit (wlenclosure) FEB2 8 2003
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron DIV.OFOIL,GAS &MINING
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STATEOFUTAH FORMS
DEPARTMENTOFNATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAME
SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to driti new wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER
OIL WELL GAS WELL Ü OTHER ,,Exhibit "A

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.AP1NUMBER:

El Paso Production Oil&Gas Company
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:

9 Greenway Plaza Houston TX .77064-0995 (832) 676-5933
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE. MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN O REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICEOF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximate date work will start: CASINGREPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATORCHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUGBACK WATERDISPOSAL .

(Submit Original Form Only)
CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF

Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details includingdates, depths, volumes, etc

Operator change to Westport Oil and Gas Company, L.P., 1670 Broadway, Suite 2800, Denver, CO. 80202-4800,
effective December 17, 2002.

BOND#

State Surety Bond No. RLBOOO5236
Fee Bond No. RLBOOO5238 RECEIVED

EL PASOfR6DUCTIOÑOIL&GAS COMPANY
FEB2 8 2003

D\V.0F OIL,GAS &MINING

By:
Jon R elsen, Attorney-in-Fact

WESTPORT OIL ANDGASCOMPANY,L.P.

NAMF (PI FASF PRINT) David R. Dix TITLE Agent and Attorney-in-Fact

SIGNATI IPF DATE

(This space for Stato use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse
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CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF

Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details includingdates, depths, volumes, etc

Operator change to Westport Oil and Gas Company, L.P., 1670 Broadway, Suite 2800, Denver, CO. 80202-4800,
effective December 17, 2002.

BOND#

State Surety Bond No. RLBOOO5236
Fee Bond No. RLBOOO5238 RECEIVED

EL PASOfR6DUCTIOÑOIL&GAS COMPANY
FEB2 8 2003

D\V.0F OIL,GAS &MINING

By:
Jon R elsen, Attorney-in-Fact

WESTPORT OIL ANDGASCOMPANY,L.P.

NAMF (PI FASF PRINT) David R. Dix TITLE Agent and Attorney-in-Fact

SIGNATI IPF DATE

(This space for Stato use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



MAR-04-2003TUE01:35 PMELPASOPRODUCTION FAXNO.4357817094 P. 02
rannsi

UNITEDSTATES nau maavio
DEPARTMENTOFTHEDiTERIOR Ch®Na ! 4005

BURRAUOFLANDMANAGEMENT
avinshwanmar.w,xco

i LeaseSerialNo.SUNDRYNOTICESANDREPORTB ONWELLS SEE ATTACHEDEXHIBIT WDo not use misArna for þf9posals 10 diffl of 200Mist an 6. Ifingan,AllonesarTribeNameabandoned well. lise Famr 3180·3 (APO) for such proposals.

7. Itt.init or CA/Asteement,Nameand/orNo.SUBMITWTMPLICATS-Otherinstrueflons on tevese side
1. tweer well

Oonwel 2o.w.n OO&g 8. We2NameandNo.2. Nameotopezar
SEEATTACHEDEXHIBIT*A"WESTPORT OIL&GAS COMPANY,L.P. 9. API WellNo.3a. Address

3b. PhonoNo.(faciudraras ade SEEATTACHEDEXHIBIT"A"P.O. BOX1148 VERNAL,UT 84078 (435) 781-7023 10. FieldandPool,orsuploratoryArea4. Iacadon ofWell(Footage,See..I, A. M, or Sawy Description;

I I. Countyor Parish,StateSEE ATTACHEDEXHIBIT"A"
UINTAHCOUNTY,UT

12. CHECKAPPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATUREOPNOTICE,R :PORT,OROTHERDATATYPEOg SUBMrssioN TYPEOPAcl10N
O Nodocoffnent Aciäm O Deepen Pmduodo(Stadesums) Q WaterShutMAlterCasing Q FractursTrent Reclamadon Q WellIntegdtyO Subsequen Repen CasingRepair Q NewCoskueden Recomplem OtherchangePlans O FlugandAbendon TemporardyAbendon SUCCESSOR OFQ FinalAbandonmentNoko Convata Wecdon Q FlugBack WaterDlsposal ÔPEAATOR13. DescribePanposedor Completed( parations(oiendystateen perdimiadetdis, includingeldmaand staltingdateof my proposedworkmdapproximatoduradon the:

It the proposal is to deepen diracdonallyor secomplets horizontdly,give subsurtheelocadens andmeasmed -d tne verticaldepuu etan pettinentmarkersand zc
Attadt theBondmdtr whichmework willbe performedor providethe BondNo, en So withBLMBIA Reedred subsequent lepotts abatibefdedwithin30 i
followingcornpletionof the involvedoperations. If theoperationresultsin a nulltiplecamp1cdon er seenupletionin a mw intervel,a Poun 31604 shall be Sted a
testing tas been completed.Fint AbandonmentNotices shall be filed onlyafkr an regtirenaris, induding seclamaden,hwe hem conipicted,and the operator
delarminedtint thesite isready1btinalinspostion.

WESTPORTOIL&GASCOMPANY,L.P.,18CONSIDEREDTOBETHEOPERATORONTHE ATTACHEDDESCRIBEDLANDSANDIS RESPONSIBLEUNDERTHETERMSANOCONDITIONSOF THELEASEFORTHEOPERATioNSCONDUCTEDONTHE LEASEDLANDSORPORTIONSTHEREOF, BONDCOVERAGEFOR THISWELLIS PROVIDEDBY FEDERALNATIONWIDEBONDNO.158626364, EFFECTIVEFEBRUARYi, 2002,ANDSIANATIONWIDESONDNO.RLBOOOS230,EFFECTIVEFEBRUARY10, 2003.

RECEIVED
MARO4 2003

14. Ihoisby fy dat the foregoingis uneand correctName
TiticHERYL ERON OPERATIONS/ ture
Date( ) March4, 2003

TNISSPACE FOR FEDERALORSTATE UBEby TIt6 bat.
Corsiitiamof appaval.ifasy.aleattacÚdAppmal of thisnodccdoes not warmator Offlogsettig esttilsappli:Aatholdslegal orcquitabletilt to thatssiglas in he embjectinnsewhichwou)4atide tiegicastta condus asson.Tide18U.S.C.Seenon1001, makeit acrimeforany personknowinglyandWDifhRytomaketoanydepirimentoragiacyofthe UnhedStatesanyfalse,ficdtiousorRandulentstatemenisorse asto anymanerwithinbejurisdiciian.Orsawatoirsen
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH

X Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent/Operator

Operator Name Change Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 12-17-02

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY WESTPORT OIL & GAS COMPANY LP
Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA Address: PO BOX 1148

HOUSTON, TX 77064-0995 VERNAL, UT 84078
Phone: 1-(832)-676-5933 Phone: 1-(435)-781-7023
Account No. N1845 Account No. N2115

CA No. Unit: NATURAL BUTTES
WELL(S)

SEC TWN API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL
NAME RNG NO TYPE TYPE STATUS
NBUCIGE 18-2-10-21 02-108-21E 43-047-30471 2900 STATE GW P
NBUCIGE80D-2-10-21 02-105-21E 43-047-30853 2900 STATE GW P
CIGE 285 02-108-21E 43-047-34793 99999 STATE GW APD
NBU CIGE 40-3-10-21 03-10S-21E 43-047-30740 2900 FEDERAL GW P
NBU CIGE 93D-3-10-21J 03-10S-21E 43-047-31163 2900 FEDERAL GW P
NBU CIGE 135-3-10-21 03-105-21E 43-047-32001 2900 FEDERAL GW S
COG NBU 101 03-10S-21E 43-047-31755 2900 FEDERAL GW P
CIGE 166-3-10-21 03-10S-21E 43-047-32172 2900 FEDERAL GW P
CIGE 225-3-10-21 03-10$-21E 43-047-33417 99999 FEDERAL GW APD
CIGE 226-3-10-21 03-108-21E 43-047-32995 2900 FEDERAL GW S
NBU 330 03-10$-21E 43-047-33228 2900 FEDERAL GW P
NBU 331 03-10$-21E 43-047-33229 2900 FEDERAL GW PA
NBU 365 03-10$-21E 43-047-33777 2900 FEDERAL GW P
NBU 25 03-10$-21E 43-047-30237 2900 FEDERAL GW PA
CIGE 206-4-10-21 04-10S-21E 43-047-32996 2900 FEDERAL GW P
NBU 326-4E 04-105-21E 43-047-33697 2900 FEDERAL GW P
CIGE 108D-4-10-21 04-105-21E 43-047-31756 2900 FEDERAL GW P
CIGE 136-4-10-21 04-105-21E 43-047-31979 2900 STATE GW S
NBU 207-4J 04-105-21E 43-047-31177 2900 FEDERAL GW P
NBU 28-4B 04-10$-21E 43-047-30367 2900 FEDERAL GW P

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 02/28/2003

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 03/04/2003

3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 03/06/2003

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 1355743-0181

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH

X Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent/Operator

Operator Name Change Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 12-17-02

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY WESTPORT OIL & GAS COMPANY LP
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Phone: 1-(832)-676-5933 Phone: 1-(435)-781-7023
Account No. N1845 Account No. N2115
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WELL(S)

SEC TWN API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL
NAME RNG NO TYPE TYPE STATUS
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NBU CIGE 135-3-10-21 03-105-21E 43-047-32001 2900 FEDERAL GW S
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CIGE 108D-4-10-21 04-105-21E 43-047-31756 2900 FEDERAL GW P
CIGE 136-4-10-21 04-105-21E 43-047-31979 2900 STATE GW S
NBU 207-4J 04-105-21E 43-047-31177 2900 FEDERAL GW P
NBU 28-4B 04-10$-21E 43-047-30367 2900 FEDERAL GW P

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 02/28/2003

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 03/04/2003

3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 03/06/2003

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 1355743-0181

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH

X Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent/Operator

Operator Name Change Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 12-17-02
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HOUSTON, TX 77064-0995 VERNAL, UT 84078
Phone: 1-(832)-676-5933 Phone: 1-(435)-781-7023
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NAME RNG NO TYPE TYPE STATUS
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COG NBU 101 03-10S-21E 43-047-31755 2900 FEDERAL GW P
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OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 02/28/2003

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 03/04/2003

3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 03/06/2003

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 1355743-0181

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted



6. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM-12/31/2003 BIA-12/5/02

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 02/27/2003

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,
for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 03/19/2003

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 03/19/2003

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: N/A

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: N/A

STATE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond Number: RLB 0005236

FEDERAL WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 158626364

INDIAN WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: RLB 0005239

FEE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number RLB 0005238

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: N/A

6. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM-12/31/2003 BIA-12/5/02

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 02/27/2003

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,
for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 03/19/2003

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 03/19/2003

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: N/A

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: N/A

STATE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond Number: RLB 0005236

FEDERAL WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 158626364

INDIAN WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: RLB 0005239

FEE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number RLB 0005238

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: N/A

6. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM-12/31/2003 BIA-12/5/02

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 02/27/2003

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,
for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 03/19/2003

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 03/19/2003

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: N/A

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: N/A

STATE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond Number: RLB 0005236

FEDERAL WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 158626364

INDIAN WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: RLB 0005239

FEE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number RLB 0005238

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: N/A



Form3160-5 UW 'D STATES FORMAPPROVED 4(August 1999' OMBNa 1004·0135' DEPARTM OF THE INTERIOR ExpiresJnovember30,2000
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTS ONWELLS Multiple Wells - see attached
Do not use this form for proposals to drfH or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3100-3 (APD) for such proposals.

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side

891008900A
1. Type of Well

O on well O = *=11 O Other 8. Well Name and No.
2. Name of Operator Multiple Wells - see attached
WESTPORT OIL &GAS COMPANY,L.P. 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) MultipleWells - see attached
P.O. BOX 1148 VERNAL, UT 84078 (435) 781- 10. Field andPool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec, T.,R., M., or Survey Descúption) Natural Buttes Unit
MultipleWells - see attached 11. County or Parish, State

UintahCounty, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, RE 'ORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Q Acidin Deepen Q Produedon (Start/Resume) Q Water Shut-Off

O ^iter casing O Fracture Treat O Reclamation Well Integrhy
O Subsequent Report Q Casing Repair O New Construction Recomplek O oser

O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon

O Final Abandonment Notice O Convert to Injection Q Plug Back Water Disposal

13. DescribeProposed or CompletedOperations(clearlystate dl pertinent details,includingestimated starting dateof my proposedwork md approximatedurationthereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured md true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attachthe Bondunder which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on filewith BLM/BIA Requiredsubsequent reports shall be filedwithin 30 daysfollowingcompletion of the involvedoperations. If theoperation results in a multiple completion or lecompletion ina new interval,a Fonn 3160·4shall be filedonce
testinghas beencompleted. FinalAbandonmertNoticesshall be filedonly after all requirements, including reclamation, have beencompleted, and the operator hasdeterminedthatthe site is ready for finalinspection.

Westport Oil&Gas requests a varianœ to Onshore Order No. 4, Part IIIC.a.requiringeach sales tankbe equipped
witha pressure-vacuum thief hatch and/or vent Ilne valve. The variance is requested as an economic analysis shows the value of the shrunk
condensate willnot payout the incremental cost of purchasing and maintainingthevalve resulting in a loss of value over the producinglife of thewell.

The volume lost to shrinkage by dropping the tankpressure from 6 ozs. to 0 psig is shown to be 0.3% of the tankvolume. This was determined by lab analysis
of a representative sample from the field.The sample shrunk from98.82% of oringinalvolume to 98.52% when the pressure was dropped.
The average NBUwell produces approximately6 bbis condensate per month.The resultingshrinkage would amount to 0.56 bbis per
month lost volume due to shrinkage. The value of the shrunk and lost condensate does not recoup or payout the cost of installing
and maintaining the valves and other devices thathold the positive tankpressure. An economic run based on the loss and costs is attached.
Westport Oil & gas requests approval of thisvariance in order to increase thevalue of the wellto the operator and the mineral royalty o ra
14. Iherebycertity that the foregomg is true and correct

Name (Printed/Typed) Title SEPi 0J.T. Conley Operations Manager
Signature ate "/ O

TgigSMCE FOR F RAL O STATE S
Approved by Title DateUtah Division am
ZohiiiLÄÑpËËi he pp o o tiSdoin Îor Office •

certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable tide to those rights in the subject Icase Í I
which would entide the applicant1o conduct operationsthereon. Û$Ì$
Title 18U.S.C.Section1001, make it a crimeforany person knowinglyand ° lly m e ofthe United Statesany
false,fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representations as to any matier wi1hmits
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Form3160-5 UW 'D STATES FORMAPPROVED 4(August 1999' OMBNa 1004·0135' DEPARTM OF THE INTERIOR ExpiresJnovember30,2000
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTS ONWELLS Multiple Wells - see attached
Do not use this form for proposals to drfH or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3100-3 (APD) for such proposals.

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side
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Westport Oil &Gas, LP.
Prolect Economics Workshet
Insbucions: FIl ln blue boxeirareas with before and after project data. The evalua11anresults

are shown below and graphed automatically at the bottom of the page. Thissheet
is protected to prevent accidental alteration of the formulas. See JTCfor changes.
OPX entered as annual costs and/or as unit OPX costs for $/BFand $/MCF

Project Narne: Condensale ŠltriningeÉconomics

is thisjob a wel puR or producion sigjob TTT (Y or N)
BEFORE AFTER DIFFERENCE
sn.« sn.or sn.or

Gross OII Revenue $1,088 $11
Gross Gas Revenue $0
NGL Revenue $0
PULIINGUNir SERVICE
WIREUNESERVICE
SUBSURFEQUIP REPAIRS
COMPANYLABOR
CONTRACT LABOR
CONTRSERVICE
LEASEFUELGAS O
UTiullES- ELECTRCITY 0
CHEMICAL TREATING
MATERIAL&SUPPLY
WATER&HAUUNG
ADMINISTRATIVECOSTS
GASPLANTPROCESSING

Totals $350 Increased OPX For Year

Investmen! Breakdown:
Cap/Exp OII Price $ 23.00 /BO

Code Cost, 5 Gas Price /MCF
Capital $ ElectricCost - / HP / day
Expense $ OPX/BF BF
Total$ OPX/MCF /MCF

Production &OPX Detai:
Before ARer DINerence

011Production 0.192 soPO Ô.194 DOPD 0.002 BoPD
Gas Production MCFPD MCFPD MCFPD
Wir Production BWPD BWPD BWPD
Horse Power HP HP HP
Fuel Gas Burned MCFPD MCFPD 0 MCFPD

Frq|ect Lie: Payout Calculatiosc
ut.-I 20.0 ¡Years

(Ufeno longer than 20 years) Payout = Total Investment = 1
Sum(OPX + incremenlai Revenue)

Infemal Rate of Retum:
ARerTax IROR•| GDIV/01 | Payout occurs when total AT cashflow equals investment

See graph below, note years when cashflow reaches zero
ATCum Cashiow:
Operating Cashflow = | ($2,917)|(Discounted @ 107.) Payout = | NEVER | Years or | #VALUEl|Days

Gross Reserves:
OEReseives = 6 BO
Gas Reserves = 0 MCF
Gas EquivReserves = 38 MCFE

Notes/Assumpilons:
An averaae NBUwell nroduces 0.192 Scud wilh no tankoressure. The nroducMon is Increased to 0.196 Ecud &4 ozs of uressure
are niaced on the tank.The increased nroducSon does NOf DGVOUt the valve cost or the esNmated annual maintenance costs.

Project: Condensate Shrinkage Economics
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Westport Oiland Gas, Inc.
NBUIOuray Field

RFL2003-022

COMPARISONOF FLASH BACK PRESSURES
Calculated by Characterized Equation-of-State

Flash Gas/Oil Specific Separator Separator
Conditions Ratio Gravityof Volume Volume

(sof/STbbi) Flashed Gas Factor Percent
(A) (Air=1.000) (B) (C)

Calculated at Laboratory Flash Condidons

80 70 1.019
0 122 30.4 0.993 1.033 101.37%
0 60 0.0 - 1.000 98.14%

Calculated Flash with Beckpsessure using Tuned EOS

80 70 1.015
6.0 oz 65 24.6 0.777 1.003 98.82%

0 60 0.0 - 1.000 98.52%

80 70 1.015
4.0 oz 65 24.7 0.778 1.003 98.82%

0 60 0.0 - 1.000 98.52%

80 70 1.015
2.0 oz 65 24.7 0.T79 1.003 98.82%

0 60 0.0 - 1.000 98.52%

80 70 1.015
0 65 24.8 0.780 1.003 98.82%
0 60 0.0 - 1.000 98.52%

(A)Cubic Feet of gas at 14.696 pela and 60 'F per Barrelof Stock Tank Oi at 60 'F.
(B) Barrels of oi at indicatedpressure and temperatureper Bamil of Stock Tank Oi at 60 'F.
(C) Oi volumeat indicatedpressure and temperatureas a percenlage of originalsaturated oi volume.
Note: Bubblepointof sample in originalsample containerwas 80 peigat 70' F with1 cc water

PENCOR Special FluidStudies Page 3 CORE
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ALL WELLS ROCKY MOUNTIANGAS-NBU ENARDO VARIANCE

WELL LEGALS STFLEASENO CANUMBER APINO
ÒIGE 003 32-9-22 SENE ML22649 891008900A 43047303200081 /
ClGE 004 9-10-21 NESE UTUO1416 891008900A 430473033400S1
CIGIEOO5 31-9-22NVVSE UO1207A 891008900A 43047303350081 /

ClGEDO6 19-9-21SVVSE UO581 891008900A 43047303560081
CIGIEOO7 8-10-21 NENVV UTUO1791 891008900A 430473035800S1
CIGE 008 35-9-22 SWSE UTUO10954A 891008900A 430473042700S1
CIGE 009 36-9-22 NWSE ML22650 891008900A 430473041900S1 /
ClGEO10 2-1(>22NVVSE ML22651 891008900A 43047304250081
CIGE 011 14-9-20 SWSE UTUO577A 891008900A 43047304240081
CIGIEO11GR 14-!¾20SVVSE UTUOS77A 891008900A 430473042400S1
CIGEO13 7-10-21 NESE UTUO2270A 891008900A 43047304200081
CIGE 014 9-10-22 NESW UTUO1196B 891008900A 43047304840081
CIGE 018 2-10-21 NWNE ML22652 891008900A 43047304710081 /
CIG.EO19 164N21SVVSVV ML3141A 891008900A 430473045900S1
ClGiEO20 20-10-21 SESVV UTUO2278 891008900A 430473048500S1
CIGEO22 15-9-20SENVV UTUO144868 891008900A 430473049700S1
CIGE 023 7-10-22 SESE ML23609 891008900A 430473033300S1 v'

CIGEO24 294)-22SESVV UO1207 891008900A 430473049300S1
CIGEO25 34-9-22SENVV UTUO149077 891008900A 430473073700S1
CIGEO27 334N22NENVV UTUO1191A 891008900A 43047307380081
CIGEO28 354¾21 NESE ML22582 891008900A 43047307390081 v'
ClIGEO30 6-1(N21 NENVV UTUO1791 891008900A 430473049800S1
CIGiEO31 1-10-22SVVNVV UO11336 891008900A 430473051100S1
CIGE 032A 20-9-20 NESW UTU01567A 891008900A 430473049600Si
ClGE 034 13-10-20 SWNE UTUO2270A 891008900A 430473050800S1
DIGEO35 1-10-20NESVV UTU02270A 891008900A 430473049400S1
CIGiEO36D 324422NVVNVV ML22649 891008900A 43047308330081 v'
ClGEO37D 21-9-21SVVSE UTUO576 891008900A 43047309100081
CIGiEO38D 4-10-21SVVSE UO1416 891008900A 430473049500S1
CIGE 040 3-10-21 NESW UTUO149078 891008900A 43047307400081
C:lGEO42 254¾21SVVSE UO4139 891008900A 430473049200Siv'
CIGE 043 14-10-22 SENW UO1197A 891008900A 430473049100S1 /
CIG.EO44 94)-21SESE UTUO1188 891008900A 43047305270081
ClGED45 154¾21NESE UTUO1193 891008900A 43047305280081
CH3ED46 214¾21NENE UTUO576 891008900A 430473052900S1
CIGEO47 14-'K)-21NVVSE UTUO1393C 891008900A 43047305100081
C:IGIE048 15-10-21 SVVNE UTUO1416A 891008900A 43047305060081
C:IGiEO51D 314¾22NENE UO1191 891008900A 43047308890081 v'
CIGiEOS2 5-10-22SENVV UTUO1195 891008900A 43047305310081
C:IGiEO53 6-1 22NESVV UTUO1195 891008900A 430473053300S1
ClGEOS4D 35-1 21 NENE ML22582 891008900A 430473085100S1 v'

CIGE 055 1-10-21 SENW ML23612 891008900A 43047305120081
CIGREO58 3449-21SVVSE UO1194A 891008000A 43047305300081
C:IGEO57 10-10-21 NENE UTUO149079 891008900A 43047305430081
C:IGiEO58 16-10-21 SESE ML10755 891008900A 43047305320081
CIGEO60 14-9-21SENVV UTUO1193 891008900A 43047305490081
CIGEŒì1 13-¾21 SENVV U01193 891008900A 430473055000S1
CIGE 062D 36-9-22 NWSW ML22650 891008900A 430473088500S1 V

ClGED63D 29-¾22NVVNVV UTU462 891008900A 43047309490081
CIGEOS4D 33-1 22SVVSVV UTUO1191A 891008900A 43047309500081
CIGE 066 23-10-21 SENW UTUO2278A 891008900A 430473054200S1
CIGIEO67A 2-10-22NENE ML22651 891008900A 43047309380081
CIGE 068D 35-9-22 NWSW UTU010954A 891008900A 430473095100S1
CIGE 069 19-10-21 SENW ML22792 891008900A 43047306350081
ClGEO70 204¾21 NESE UTUD575 891008900A 43047306360081
CIGIE071 7-lh21NESE UTUO575B 891008900A 43047306370081
CIGE 072 18-9-21 SWNE UTUO575 891008900A 43047306340081
CIGEO73D 5-10-22SVVSVV UTUO1191A 891008900A 43047309520081
CIGHEO74D 6-'K)-22NVVSE UTUO1195 891008900A 43047309530081
CIGiEO75D 8-'KN21 SENE UTUO1791 891008900A 430473095400$1
CIGEO76D 9-10-21 NENE UTUO1416 891008900A 43047309550081
CIGIEO77D 10-H)-21SESE UTU0149079 891008900A 430473095600S1
CIGE 078C 16-9-21 NENW UTU38409 891008900A 43047308700081
CIGEO79D 1-10-21 NENE ML23612 891008900A 43047308960081 v'
CIGE 080D 2-10-21 NWNW ML22652 891008900A 43047308530081 /
CIGE 081D 4-10-21 NENE ML22940 891008900A 430473085400S1
CIGE 086D 16-9-21 SWSE ML3282 891008900A 43047308860081
DIGIEO87D 344¾21 NENE UO1194A 891008900A 430473086900S1V>

DIGEO88D 15-'KN21 NVVNVV UTUO1791A 891008900A 430473095800S1
CIGHË089D 344)-22SENE UTUO149077 891008900A 43047311460081
CIGEO90D 9-EN21 NVVNE UTUO1188A 891008900A 430473114900Si
ClGiEO91D 15-9-21 NVVNE UTUO1188 891008900A
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O
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

ML-22652
6. IF 1NDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do notuse this form for proposals to drill new wells, s¡gnificantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to UNIT #891008900Adrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL O OTHER 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

CIGE 80DG49-24•
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

KERR McGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE LP 4304730853
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST , VERNAL sTATE UT ZlP84078 (435) 781-7024 NATURALBUTTES

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 870'FNL, 1018'FWL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNW 2 10S 21E STATE:
UTAH

n. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTlON (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SlTE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly showall pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

THE OPERATOR REQUESTS AUTHORIZATIONTO PLACE THE SUBJECT WELL LOCATIONON TEMPORARILY
ABANDONMENT STATUS. THE SUBJECT WELL LOCATIONIS CURRENTLY BEING EVALUATED FOR PLUG AND
ABANDONMENSTATUS.

NAGMNEAT DATE SE OR LANDADMIN SPECIALIST

(This space for State use only) gh DivlSIOn 0

(5/2000) ee Instructions on Reverse
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State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER
. ..,,,,J ExecutiveDirector

JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
ÛÎVision of Oil, Gas and Mining

Governor JOHN R. BAZA
Division Director

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

October 1, 2008

CERTIFIED MAIL NO. 7004 2510 0004 1824 6466

43 O‡~l 5563
Ms. Sheila Upchego
Kerr McGee Oil & Gas Onshore LP
1368 South 1200 East /Û $
Vernal, UT 84078

Re: Extended Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned Well Requirements for Wells on Fee
or State Leases

Dear Ms. Upchego,

As of July 2008, Kerr McGee Oil & Gas has twenty-eight (28) State and Mineral Lease
Wells (see attachment A) that are in non-compliance with the requirements for extended shut-in
or temporarily abandoned (SI/TA) status. Wells SI/TA beyond twelve (12) consecutive months
require filing of a Sundry Notice in accordance with R649-3-36-1 for Utah Division of Oil, Gas
& Mining ("Division") approval. Wells with five (5) years non-activity or non-productivity shall
be plugged, unless the Division grants approval for extended shut-in time upon showing of good
cause by the operator (R649-3-36-1.3.3).

For extended SI/TA consideration the operator shall provide the Division with the following:

1. Reasons for SI/TA of the well (R649-3-36-1.1).

2. The length of time the well is expected to be SI/TA (R649-3-36-1.2), and

3. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well has
integrity, meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition, static fluid level,
pressure, existence or absence of Underground Sources of Drinking Water and
other factors do not make the well a risk to public health and safety or the
environment (R649-3-36-1.3).

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340•facsimile (801) 359-3940 •TTY (801) 538-7458 • www.ogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS &
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Re: Extended Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned Well Requirements for Wells on Fee
or State Leases

Dear Ms. Upchego,

As of July 2008, Kerr McGee Oil & Gas has twenty-eight (28) State and Mineral Lease
Wells (see attachment A) that are in non-compliance with the requirements for extended shut-in
or temporarily abandoned (SI/TA) status. Wells SI/TA beyond twelve (12) consecutive months
require filing of a Sundry Notice in accordance with R649-3-36-1 for Utah Division of Oil, Gas
& Mining ("Division") approval. Wells with five (5) years non-activity or non-productivity shall
be plugged, unless the Division grants approval for extended shut-in time upon showing of good
cause by the operator (R649-3-36-1.3.3).

For extended SI/TA consideration the operator shall provide the Division with the following:

1. Reasons for SI/TA of the well (R649-3-36-1.1).

2. The length of time the well is expected to be SI/TA (R649-3-36-1.2), and

3. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well has
integrity, meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition, static fluid level,
pressure, existence or absence of Underground Sources of Drinking Water and
other factors do not make the well a risk to public health and safety or the
environment (R649-3-36-1.3).

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340•facsimile (801) 359-3940 •TTY (801) 538-7458 • www.ogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS &



Page 2
October 1, 2008
Ms. Upchego

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity and may help
qualify your well for extended SI/TA. Note: As of July 1, 2003, wells in violation of the
SI/TA rule R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-1-4.2, 4.3).

1. Wellbore diagram, and

2. Copy of recent casing pressure test, and

3. Current pressures on the wellbore (tubing pressure, casing pressure, and
easing/casing annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity, and

4. Fluid level in the wellbore, and

5. An explanation of how the submitted information proves integrity.

If the required information is not received within 30 days of the date of this notice,
further actions may be initiated. If you have any questions concerning this matter, please
contact me at (801) 538-5281.

S

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

js
Enclosure

cc: Jim Davis, SITLA
Operator Compliance File
Well
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ATTACHMENT A

Well Name API Lease Type Location Years Inactive
1 CIGE 5 43-047-30335 STATE NWSE Sec 31-09$-22E l Year 4 Months

2 CIGE 54D 43-047-30851 ML-22582 NENE Sec 35-09S-21E 2 Years 4 Months

3 CIGE 80D 43-047-30853 ML-22652 NWNW Sec 02-10S-21E 1 Year

4 CIGE 51D 43-047-30889 STATE NENE Sec 31-09S-22E l Year 3 Months

5 NBU 54N 43-047-30890 ML-22649 NESW Sec 32-09S-22E 1 Year 3 Months

6 CIGE 92D 43-047-31162 STATE SENW Sec 13-10$-20E 1 Year

7 NBU 213-36J 43-047-31268 ML-22650 NENE Sec 36-09S-22E 1 Year 1 Month

8 ARCHY BENCH STATE 1-2 43-047-31489 ML-22348-A NENE Sec 02-11S-22E 1 Year 10 Months

9 CIGE 97D 43-047-31729 STATE SESE Sec 31-09S-22E 1 Year 7 Months

10 NBU 157 43-047-32007 ML-22649 SESW Sec 32-09S-22E 1 Year 3 Months

11 NBU 343-36E 43-047-32205 ML-22650 SENW Sec 36-09S-22E 1 Year 7 Months

12 NBU 265 43-047-32796 ML-13826 NESE Sec 02-10S-21E 1 Year 2 Months

13 MORGAN STATE 12-36 43-047-32814 ML-22265 NESE Sec 36-09S-21E 1 Year

14 WONSITS STATE 1-32 43-047-32820 ML-47780 SWNE Sec 32-07S-22E 4 Years

15 NBU 333 43-047-33641 ML-23608 SWSW Sec 13-10S-21E 1 Year 6 Months

16 NBU 389 43-047-34229 ML-21329 NENE Sec 28-10S-21E 1 year 4 Months

17 STATE 921-32P 43-047-34422 ML-48758 SESE Sec 32-09S-21E 1 Year 5 Months

18 STATE 920-36P 43-047-34423 ML-48757 SESE Sec 36-09S-20E 2 years 9 Months

19 NBU 440 43-047-34785 STATE SWNW Sec 34-09S-21E 1 Year 4 Months

20 NBU 442 43-047-34788 STATE NWSW Sec 35-09S-21E 2 Years 8 Months

21 CIGE 284 43-047-34792 ML-23612 SWNW Sec 01-10S-21E 1 Year 2 Months

22 CIGE 285 43-047-34793 ML-22652 NENE Sec 02-10S-21E 1 Year 8 Months

23 STATE 920-360 43-047-35788 ML-48757 SWSE Sec 36-09$-20E 1 Year 8 Months

24 NBU 1022-16G 43-047-35948 ML-3276 SWNE Sec 16-10S-22E 1 Year 2 Months

25 NBU 1022-16B 43-047-36158 ML-3276 NWNE Sec 16-10S-22E l Year 3 Months

26 NBU 921-34K 43-047-36389 STATE NESW Sec 34-09S-21E 1 Year 2 Months

27 BONANZA 1023-16J 43-047-37092 ML-22186-A NWSE Sec 16-10S-23E 1 Year 4 Months

28 NBU 921-34J 43-047-37953 STATE NWSE Sec 34-09S-21E 1
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If KerrRGee
Kerr McGee Oil and Gas Onshore LP
1368 SOUTH 1200 EAsT • VERNAL, UT 84078
435-789-4433• FAX 435-781-7094

November 10, 2008

Mr. Dustin K. Doucet
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

RE: Extended Shut-In and Temporarily Abandoned Wells
Greater Natural Buttes Area

Dear Mr. Doucet:

Our plan of action for wells cited in your October 1, 2008, letter regarding SI and TA
wells is attached. We plan to plug, recomplete or workover every well on the list during
the next six months. We will positively establish casing rnechanical integrity at that time.
In particular, the EPA has requested an expanded Area of Review for the UIC permits we

have either received or are preparing. We have to have a plan for a large number of wells
in the bottom tier of sections in Township 9S-2lE

. These are shown in bold font.

We have not enclosed all of the data requested in light of the fact that we plan to mobilize
on these wells in the near future. If you still require that data, please let us know and we
will conamence gathering it.

RECEIVED
NOV12 2008

DIVOFOiL,GAS&
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NOVi 2 2008

CATEGORY3 - STATE OR FEE SHUTINWELL LIST

PGA
Well Reason for SIITA Timing Comments Reasoning for POA

2009 Refrac & recomplete potential exists in well. Work willbe done ro establish production.
Wonsits State 1-32 NDÍCOmpleted in best existing quality pay 01 2009 Recomplete potential exists in well. Work will be done ro establish production.
State 920-36P Highwater producer with very little pas prodution Q2 2009 Reviewnf new drillswithin sertion & watPr Shilt OÍTWnrk nPPr!PA10 PIPIPrminR nntPntial Water ohnt off nr PP A will be tornmmentler!

State 920-360 Highwater producer with very little pas prodution O2 2009 Reviewof new drillswithin section &water shut offwork needed to determine potential. Water shut off or P&Awillbe recommended.

NBU 1022-16G Highwater producer with very little pas prodution
__

0 Should not be classified as SI as a WSO was performed & productionwas established in May of 2008. Current rates of 156 mcfd &69 bwpd.
NBU 1022-188 Highwater producerwith very little gas prodution ' O Should not be classified as SI as a WSO was performed &productionwas established in May of2008. Current rates of g5 mcfd &69 bwpd.
NBU213-36J EOG operated well.
NBU343-36E EOG operated welL
BONANZA 1023-16J Permits being prepared for additional wells Surface casing set, preparing additional APD's to use location as a multi-well pad. This well will be drilledwith the others.

CIGE5 1.4 BefTwCum. Twinned in 2007. 01 2009 Can P&A.
CIGEBOD 0.4 BefTwCum. Lowpas production. Q1 2009 Potential for Clean out and RTP.
CIGE51D 1.0 BefTwCum. Twinned in 2007. Q1 2009 Can P&A.
NBU54N 1.4 Bef Tw Cum. Twinned in 2007. Q1 2009 Can P&A.
CIGE92D 1.6 OcfTw Cum. Q1 2009 Will review for bypassed pay. Prob depleted and can P&A.
CIGE97D 0.4 BefTw Cum. Twinned in 2007. Q1 2009 Can P&A.
NBU 157 0.5 OcfTw Cum. Twinned in 2007. Q1 2009 Can P&A.
NBU265 0.05 OcfTw. Refraced in 2007. Q1 2009 High risk RC cand: 1.7 Ocf Oifset. BBXGprob beter RC candidate. Therefore P&A.
NBU333 0.09 BefW/TM. RC Candidate. 04 2008 Reviewed 11-06 by kfm (rne). Time to RC.
NBU389 0.07 BcfTw Curn. RC Candidate. Q1 2009 2002 Vintage. Reviewfor RC.
ClGE 54D 0.95 Bcf Tw Cum. SI in 2006. Q42008 Will review for RC potential. Within EPA requested Area of Review.
MORGANSTATE 12-36 0.09 Bef W/TM. Q1 2009 Note comm w 41J, 2.7 Bef well. Prob fraced into in 1997. High risk RC. P&A. Within EPA requested Area of Review.

STATE 92132P 0.1 Bef WTfM/MM. High water producer. Q12009 Pkr below Mid Tw prod log, unsuccessful water shut off. Try pkr at Top of Kmv. Wihin EPA requested Area of Review.
NBU440 0.01 Bcf WTTM/MM.Hi.qhwater producer. Q1 2009 Attempt to set pkr at top of Kmv and produce.
CIGE285 0.1 Bef. W/TM/MM. High water producer. Q1 2009 Attempt to set pkr at top of Kmv and produce.
NBU442 0.42008 UICpermit application being prepared.
CIGE284 Q1 2009 Within EPA requested Area of Review.
CIGE285 Q1 2009 \Within EPA requested Area of Review.
NBU92134K Q12009 Mobilizing to convert well to injection.
NBU92134J Q12009 Test Green River. UICcandidate. Within EPA requested Area of
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PGA
Well Reason for SIITA Timing Comments Reasoning for POA
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CIGE5 1.4 BefTwCum. Twinned in 2007. 01 2009 Can P&A.
CIGEBOD 0.4 BefTwCum. Lowpas production. Q1 2009 Potential for Clean out and RTP.
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State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER
,,-•" ExecutiveDirector

JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
ÜÎVÎSion of Oil Gas and Mining

Governor JOHN R, BAZA
Division Director

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

December 23, 2008

CERTIFIED MAIL NO.: 7004 2510 0004 1824 6633

Ms. Ramey Hoopes
Kerr McGee Oil and Gas
1368 South 1200 East
Vernal, UT 84078

SUBJECT: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned Well Requirements for Fee or State Leases
dated September 23, 2008

Dear Ms. Hoopes:

The Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (Division) is in receipt of your letter dated
November 10, 2008 (received by the Division on November 12, 2008) in regards to the twenty-
eight (28) shut-in or temporarily abandoned (SI/TA) wells operated by Kerr McGee Oil and Gas
(Kerr McGee). It is the Divisions understanding that Kerr McGee plans to plug, recomplete or
workover every well on Attachment A during the next six months.

Based on the submitted information and plan to bring the listed wells out of non-
compliance status within a six month period the Division grants extended SI/TA status for the
wells listed on Attachment A until September 1, 2009, allowing adequate time to perform the
proposed work.

If you have any questions or need additional assistance in regards to the above
matters please contact me at (801) 538-5281

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

DKD/JP/js
Enclosure
cc: Jim Davis, SITLA

Operator Compliance File
Well File UTAH
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ATTACHMENT A

Well Name API Lease Type Location Years Inactive
1 CIGE 5 43-047-30335 STATE NWSE Sec 31-09S-22E 1 Year 4 Months

2 CIGE 54D 43-047-30851 ML-22582 NENE Sec 35-09S-21E 2 Years 4 Months

3 CIGE 80D 43-047-30853 ML-22652 NWNW Sec 02-10S-21E 1 Year

4 CIGE 51D 43-047-30889 STATE NENE Sec 31-09S-22E 1 Year 3 Months

5 NBU 54N 43-047-30890 ML-22649 NESW Sec 32-09S-22E 1 Year 3 Months

6 CIGE 92D 43-047-31162 STATE SENW Sec 13-10S-20E 1 Year

7 NBU 213-36J 43-047-31268 ML-22650 NENE Sec 36-09S-22E 1 Year 1 Month

8 ARCHY BENCH STATE 1-2 43-047-31489 ML-22348-A NENE Sec 02-11S-22E 1 Year 10 Months

9 CIGE 97D 43-047-31729 STATE SESE Sec 31-09S-22E 1 Year 7 Months

10 NBU 157 43-047-32007 ML-22649 SESW Sec 32-09S-22E 1 Year 3 Months

11 NBU 343-36E 43-047-32205 ML-22650 SENW Sec 36-09S-22E 1 Year 7 Months

12 NBU 265 43-047-32796 ML-13826 NESE Sec 02-10S-21E 1 Year 2 Months

13 MORGAN STATE 12-36 43-047-32814 ML-22265 NESE Sec 36-09S-21E 1 Year

14 WONSITS STATE 1-32 43-047-32820 ML-47780 SWNE Sec 32-07S-22E 4 Years

15 NBU 333 43-047-33641 ML-23608 SWSW Sec 13-10S-21E 1 Year 6 Months

16 NBU 389 43-047-34229 ML-21329 NENE Sec 28-10S-21E 1 year 4 Months

17 STATE 921-32P 43-047-34422 ML-48758 SESE Sec 32-09S-21E 1 Year 5 Months

18 STATE 920-36P 43-047-34423 ML-48757 SESE Sec 36-09S-20E 2 years 9 Months

19 NBU 440 43-047-34785 STATE SWNW Sec 34-09S-21E 1 Year 4 Months
20 NBU 442 43-047-34788 STATE NWSW Sec 35-09S-21E 2 Years 8 Months

21 CIGE 284 43-047-34792 ML-23612 SWNW Sec 01-10S-21E 1 Year 2 Months

22 CIGE 285 43-047-34793 ML-22652 NENE Sec 02-10S-21E 1 Year 8 Months

23 STATE 920-360 43-047-35788 ML-48757 SWSE Sec 36-09S-20E 1 Year 8 Months

24 NBU 1022-16G 43-047-35948 ML-3276 SWNE Sec 16-10S-22E 1 Year 2 Months

25 NBU 1022-16B 43-047-36158 ML-3276 NWNE Sec 16-10S-22E 1 Year 3 Months

26 NBU 921-34K 43-047-36389 STATE NESW Sec 34-09S-21E 1 Year 2 Months

27 BONANZA 1023-16J 43-047-37092 ML-22186-A NWSE Sec 16-10S-23E 1 Year 4 Months

28 NBU 921-34J 43-047-37953 STATE NWSE Sec 34-09S-21E 1 Year
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19 NBU 440 43-047-34785 STATE SWNW Sec 34-09S-21E 1 Year 4 Months
20 NBU 442 43-047-34788 STATE NWSW Sec 35-09S-21E 2 Years 8 Months

21 CIGE 284 43-047-34792 ML-23612 SWNW Sec 01-10S-21E 1 Year 2 Months
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State of Utah
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MICHAEL R. STYLER
Executive Director

JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
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Governor JOHN R. BAZA
Division Director
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December 23, 2008
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CERTIFIED REL NO.: 7001 25199001 l?2^ff33 (atumed unclaimed)
CERTIFIED MAIL NO.: 7004 2510 0004 1824 6695

Ms. Ramey Hoopes
Kerr McGee Oil and Gas
1368 South 1200 East
Vernal, UT 84078

SUBJECT: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned Well Requirements for Fee or State Leases dated
September 23, 2008

Dear Ms. Hoopes:

The Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (Division) is in receipt of your letter dated
November 10, 2008 (received by the Division on November 12, 2008) in regards to the twenty-
eight (28) shut-in or temporarily abandoned (SI/TA) wells operated by Kerr McGee Oil and Gas
(Kerr McGee). It is the Divisions understanding that Kerr McGee plans to plug, recomplete or
workover every well on Attachment A during the next six months.

Based on the submitted information and plan to bring the listed wells out of non-
compliance status within a six month period the Division grants extended SI/TA status for the
wells listed on Attachment A until September 1, 2009, allowing adequate time to perform the
proposed work.

If you have any questions or need additional assistance in regards to the above matters
please contact me at (801) 538-5281

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

DKD/JP/js
Enclosure
cc: Jim Davis, SITLA

Operator Compliance File UNH

Well File DNR
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ATTACHMENT A

Well Name API Lease Type Location Years Inactive
1 CIGE 5 43-047-30335 STATE NWSE Sec 31-09S-22E 1 Year 4 Months

2 CIGE 54D 43-047-30851 ML-22582 NENE Sec 35-09S-21E 2 Years 4 Months

3 CIGE 80D 43-047-30853 ML-22652 NWNW Sec 02-10S-21E 1 Year

4 CIGE 51D 43-047-30889 STATE NENE Sec 31-09S-22E 1 Year 3 Months

5 NBU 54N 43-047-30890 ML-22649 NESW Sec 32-09S-22E 1 Year 3 Months

6 CIGE 92D 43-047-31162 STATE SENW Sec 13-10S-20E 1 Year

7 NBU 213-36J 43-047-31268 ML-22650 NENE Sec 36-09S-22E 1 Year 1 Month

8 ARCHY BENCH STATE 1-2 43-047-31489 ML-22348-A NENE Sec 02-11S-22E 1 Year 10 Months

9 CIGE 97D 43-047-31729 STATE SESE Sec 31-09S-22E 1 Year 7 Months

10 NBU 157 43-047-32007 ML-22649 SESW Sec 32-09S-22E 1 Year 3 Months

11 NBU 343-36E 43-047-32205 ML-22650 SENW Sec 36-098-22E 1 Year 7 Months

12 NBU 265 43-047-32796 ML-13826 NESE Sec 02-10S-21E 1 Year 2 Months

13 MORGAN STATE 12-36 43-047-32814 ML-22265 NESE Sec 36-09S-21E 1 Year

14 WONSITS STATE 1-32 43-047-32820 ML-47780 SWNE Sec 32-07S-22E 4 Years

15 NBU 333 43-047-33641 ML-23608 SWSW Sec 13-10S-21E 1 Year 6 Months

16 NBU 389 43-047-34229 ML-21329 NENE Sec 28-10S-21E 1 year 4 Months

17 STATE 921-32P 43-047-34422 ML-48758 SESE Sec 32-09S-21E 1 Year 5 Months

18 STATE 920-36P 43-047-34423 ML-48757 SESE Sec 36-09S-20E 2 years 9 Months

19 NBU 440 43-047-34785 STATE SWNW Sec 34-09S-21E 1 Year 4 Months

20 NBU 442 43-047-34788 STATE NWSW Sec 35-09S-21E 2 Years 8 Months

21 CIGE 284 43-047-34792 ML-23612 SWNW Sec 01-10S-21E 1 Year 2 Months

22 CIGE 285 43-047-34793 ML-22652 NENE Sec 02-10S-21E 1 Year 8 Months

23 STATE 920-360 43-047-35788 ML-48757 SWSE Sec 36-09S-20E 1 Year 8 Months

24 NBU 1022-16G 43-047-35948 ML-3276 SWNE Sec 16-10S-22E 1 Year 2 Months

25 NBU 1022-16B 43-047-36158 ML-3276 NWNE Sec 16-10S-22E 1 Year 3 Months

26 NBU 921-34K 43-047-36389 STATE NESW Sec 34-09S-21E 1 Year 2 Months

27 BONANZA 1023-16J 43-047-37092 ML-22186-A NWSE Sec 16-10S-23E 1 Year 4 Months

28 NBU 921-34J 43-047-37953 STATE NWSE Sec 34-09S-21E 1 Year
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ATTACHMENT A

Well Name API Lease Type Location Years Inactive
1 CIGE 5 43-047-30335 STATE NWSE Sec 31-09S-22E 1 Year 4 Months

2 CIGE 54D 43-047-30851 ML-22582 NENE Sec 35-09S-21E 2 Years 4 Months

3 CIGE 80D 43-047-30853 ML-22652 NWNW Sec 02-10S-21E 1 Year

4 CIGE 51D 43-047-30889 STATE NENE Sec 31-09S-22E 1 Year 3 Months

5 NBU 54N 43-047-30890 ML-22649 NESW Sec 32-09S-22E 1 Year 3 Months

6 CIGE 92D 43-047-31162 STATE SENW Sec 13-10S-20E 1 Year

7 NBU 213-36J 43-047-31268 ML-22650 NENE Sec 36-09S-22E 1 Year 1 Month

8 ARCHY BENCH STATE 1-2 43-047-31489 ML-22348-A NENE Sec 02-11S-22E 1 Year 10 Months

9 CIGE 97D 43-047-31729 STATE SESE Sec 31-09S-22E 1 Year 7 Months

10 NBU 157 43-047-32007 ML-22649 SESW Sec 32-09S-22E 1 Year 3 Months

11 NBU 343-36E 43-047-32205 ML-22650 SENW Sec 36-098-22E 1 Year 7 Months

12 NBU 265 43-047-32796 ML-13826 NESE Sec 02-10S-21E 1 Year 2 Months

13 MORGAN STATE 12-36 43-047-32814 ML-22265 NESE Sec 36-09S-21E 1 Year

14 WONSITS STATE 1-32 43-047-32820 ML-47780 SWNE Sec 32-07S-22E 4 Years

15 NBU 333 43-047-33641 ML-23608 SWSW Sec 13-10S-21E 1 Year 6 Months

16 NBU 389 43-047-34229 ML-21329 NENE Sec 28-10S-21E 1 year 4 Months

17 STATE 921-32P 43-047-34422 ML-48758 SESE Sec 32-09S-21E 1 Year 5 Months

18 STATE 920-36P 43-047-34423 ML-48757 SESE Sec 36-09S-20E 2 years 9 Months

19 NBU 440 43-047-34785 STATE SWNW Sec 34-09S-21E 1 Year 4 Months

20 NBU 442 43-047-34788 STATE NWSW Sec 35-09S-21E 2 Years 8 Months

21 CIGE 284 43-047-34792 ML-23612 SWNW Sec 01-10S-21E 1 Year 2 Months

22 CIGE 285 43-047-34793 ML-22652 NENE Sec 02-10S-21E 1 Year 8 Months

23 STATE 920-360 43-047-35788 ML-48757 SWSE Sec 36-09S-20E 1 Year 8 Months

24 NBU 1022-16G 43-047-35948 ML-3276 SWNE Sec 16-10S-22E 1 Year 2 Months

25 NBU 1022-16B 43-047-36158 ML-3276 NWNE Sec 16-10S-22E 1 Year 3 Months

26 NBU 921-34K 43-047-36389 STATE NESW Sec 34-09S-21E 1 Year 2 Months

27 BONANZA 1023-16J 43-047-37092 ML-22186-A NWSE Sec 16-10S-23E 1 Year 4 Months

28 NBU 921-34J 43-047-37953 STATE NWSE Sec 34-09S-21E 1 Year
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ATTACHMENT A

Well Name API Lease Type Location Years Inactive
1 CIGE 5 43-047-30335 STATE NWSE Sec 31-09S-22E 1 Year 4 Months

2 CIGE 54D 43-047-30851 ML-22582 NENE Sec 35-09S-21E 2 Years 4 Months

3 CIGE 80D 43-047-30853 ML-22652 NWNW Sec 02-10S-21E 1 Year

4 CIGE 51D 43-047-30889 STATE NENE Sec 31-09S-22E 1 Year 3 Months

5 NBU 54N 43-047-30890 ML-22649 NESW Sec 32-09S-22E 1 Year 3 Months

6 CIGE 92D 43-047-31162 STATE SENW Sec 13-10S-20E 1 Year

7 NBU 213-36J 43-047-31268 ML-22650 NENE Sec 36-09S-22E 1 Year 1 Month

8 ARCHY BENCH STATE 1-2 43-047-31489 ML-22348-A NENE Sec 02-11S-22E 1 Year 10 Months

9 CIGE 97D 43-047-31729 STATE SESE Sec 31-09S-22E 1 Year 7 Months

10 NBU 157 43-047-32007 ML-22649 SESW Sec 32-09S-22E 1 Year 3 Months

11 NBU 343-36E 43-047-32205 ML-22650 SENW Sec 36-098-22E 1 Year 7 Months

12 NBU 265 43-047-32796 ML-13826 NESE Sec 02-10S-21E 1 Year 2 Months

13 MORGAN STATE 12-36 43-047-32814 ML-22265 NESE Sec 36-09S-21E 1 Year

14 WONSITS STATE 1-32 43-047-32820 ML-47780 SWNE Sec 32-07S-22E 4 Years

15 NBU 333 43-047-33641 ML-23608 SWSW Sec 13-10S-21E 1 Year 6 Months

16 NBU 389 43-047-34229 ML-21329 NENE Sec 28-10S-21E 1 year 4 Months

17 STATE 921-32P 43-047-34422 ML-48758 SESE Sec 32-09S-21E 1 Year 5 Months

18 STATE 920-36P 43-047-34423 ML-48757 SESE Sec 36-09S-20E 2 years 9 Months

19 NBU 440 43-047-34785 STATE SWNW Sec 34-09S-21E 1 Year 4 Months

20 NBU 442 43-047-34788 STATE NWSW Sec 35-09S-21E 2 Years 8 Months

21 CIGE 284 43-047-34792 ML-23612 SWNW Sec 01-10S-21E 1 Year 2 Months

22 CIGE 285 43-047-34793 ML-22652 NENE Sec 02-10S-21E 1 Year 8 Months

23 STATE 920-360 43-047-35788 ML-48757 SWSE Sec 36-09S-20E 1 Year 8 Months

24 NBU 1022-16G 43-047-35948 ML-3276 SWNE Sec 16-10S-22E 1 Year 2 Months

25 NBU 1022-16B 43-047-36158 ML-3276 NWNE Sec 16-10S-22E 1 Year 3 Months

26 NBU 921-34K 43-047-36389 STATE NESW Sec 34-09S-21E 1 Year 2 Months

27 BONANZA 1023-16J 43-047-37092 ML-22186-A NWSE Sec 16-10S-23E 1 Year 4 Months

28 NBU 921-34J 43-047-37953 STATE NWSE Sec 34-09S-21E 1 Year
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. DJJ

X Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 1/6/2006
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2115-Westport Oil & Gas Co., LP N2995-Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore, LP

1368 South 1200 East 1368 South 1200 East
Vernal, UT 84078 Vernal, UT 84078

Phone: 1-(435) 781-7024 Phone; 1-(435) 781-7024

CA No. Unit: NATURAL BUTTES UNIT
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL

NO TYPE TYPE STATUS

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 5/10/2006
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 5/10/2006
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 3/7/2006
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Nurnber: 1355743-0181

4b. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a 3 LAwells & all PA wells transferred
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 3/27/2006 BIA not yet

7. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 3/27/2006

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanecd/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on:

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 5/15/2006
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 5/15/2006
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 5/15/2006
4. Fee/State wolls attached to bond in RBDMS on: 5/16/2006
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on:
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a Name Change Only
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: COl203
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: RLB0005239
3. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number RLB0005236
a. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a rider added KMG

The Division sent response by letter on;
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 5/16/2006
COMMENTS:
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. DJJ

X Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 1/6/2006
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2115-Westport Oil & Gas Co., LP N2995-Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore, LP

1368 South 1200 East 1368 South 1200 East
Vernal, UT 84078 Vernal, UT 84078

Phone: 1-(435) 781-7024 Phone; 1-(435) 781-7024

CA No. Unit: NATURAL BUTTES UNIT
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL

NO TYPE TYPE STATUS

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 5/10/2006
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 5/10/2006
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 3/7/2006
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Nurnber: 1355743-0181

4b. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a 3 LAwells & all PA wells transferred
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 3/27/2006 BIA not yet

7. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 3/27/2006

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanecd/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on:

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 5/15/2006
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 5/15/2006
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 5/15/2006
4. Fee/State wolls attached to bond in RBDMS on: 5/16/2006
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on:
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a Name Change Only
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: COl203
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: RLB0005239
3. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number RLB0005236
a. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a rider added KMG

The Division sent response by letter on;
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 5/16/2006
COMMENTS:
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. DJJ

X Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 1/6/2006
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2115-Westport Oil & Gas Co., LP N2995-Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore, LP

1368 South 1200 East 1368 South 1200 East
Vernal, UT 84078 Vernal, UT 84078

Phone: 1-(435) 781-7024 Phone; 1-(435) 781-7024

CA No. Unit: NATURAL BUTTES UNIT
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL

NO TYPE TYPE STATUS

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 5/10/2006
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 5/10/2006
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 3/7/2006
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Nurnber: 1355743-0181

4b. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a 3 LAwells & all PA wells transferred
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 3/27/2006 BIA not yet

7. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 3/27/2006

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanecd/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on:

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 5/15/2006
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 5/15/2006
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 5/15/2006
4. Fee/State wolls attached to bond in RBDMS on: 5/16/2006
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on:
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a Name Change Only
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: COl203
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: RLB0005239
3. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number RLB0005236
a. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a rider added KMG

The Division sent response by letter on;
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 5/16/2006
COMMENTS:
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' Form3160-5 UNITEDSTATES '°2"^"" °YE
(August 1999) OMB No. 1004-0135DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ExpiresJnovemter30,2000

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Señal No.
SUNDRYNOTICESANDREPORTS ON WELLS MULTIPLELEASES

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Porm 3160·3 (APD)for such proposals.

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No
SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE- Other instructIons on reverse side

I. Type of Well

O on wen U oaswell O Other 8. Well Name and No.
2. NameofOperator MUTIPLEWELLS
KERR-McGEEOIL & GAS ONSHORE LP 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No (include area code)
1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL, UT 84078 (435) 781-7024 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T.,R., M ,
or Survey Description)

I 1. County or Parish, State
SEE ATTACHED

UINTAHCOUNTY, UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, R3PORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent Q Acidize O Deepen Q Production (Start/Resume) O Water Shut-Off
O ^iter c.sing O Practure Treat O Recl===tion O wenIntestav

Subsequent Report Q Casing Repair O New Construction Q Recomplete Other CHANGE OF
O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon Q Temporarily Abandon OPERATOR

O Final Abandonment Notice O Convert to Injection O Plug Back Q Water Disposal

13. DescribeProposed or CompletedOperations(cleadystate all pertinentdetails,includingestimatedstartingdateof anypoposed work andapproximatedurationthereof
If the proposalis to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurfacelocationsand measuredandtrue vertical depths of all peltinentmarkers andzones.
Attach the Bondunder which the work will be performedor providethe BondNo. on file with BLM/BIA Requiredsubsequentreportsshallbe filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involvedoperations. If the operation osults in a multiple cornpletionor recompletionin a new interval,a Form31604 shallbe filedonce
testing has been completed. Final AbandonmentNotices shallbe filed only afta all requirements, includingoclamation, have been completed, and the operatorhasdeterminedthat the site isready for finalinspection.

PLEASE BE ADVISED THAT KERR-McGEE OIL &GAS ONSHORELP, IS CONSIDERED TO BE THE RECEIVEDOPERATOR OF THE ATTACHED WELL LOCATIONS. EFFECTIVE JANUARY 6, 2006.
KERR-McGEE OIL &GAS ONSHORE LP, IS RESPONSIBLE UNDER TERMS AND CONDITIONs MAYl 0 2006
OF THE LEASE(S) FOR THE OPERATIONS CONDUCTED UPON LEASE LANDS. BOND COVERAGE
IS PROVIDED BY STATE OF UTAH NATIONWIDEBOND NO. RLBOOO5237. Ï)IV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

ß Cm Bod d o/aos APPROVEDJUL6

Nat rinted/Typed) Title Earlene Russell,EngineeringTechnician
Y AY DRILLINGMANAGER

ture Date
May 9, 2006

f THIS SPACE FOR FEDERALOR STATEUSE
Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, ifany, are attached Approval of thisnotice doesnot warrant or Office
certify thatthe applicant holds Icgal or equitable title to thoserights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18U.S.C.Section 1001, make it a crime forany personknowinglyand willfullyto make to any departmentor agencyofthe UnitedStatesany
falæ, fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representationsas to anymatter withinitsjurisdiction.

(Instructions on

' Form3160-5 UNITEDSTATES '°2"^"" °YE
(August 1999) OMB No. 1004-0135DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ExpiresJnovemter30,2000

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Señal No.
SUNDRYNOTICESANDREPORTS ON WELLS MULTIPLELEASES

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Porm 3160·3 (APD)for such proposals.

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No
SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE- Other instructIons on reverse side

I. Type of Well

O on wen U oaswell O Other 8. Well Name and No.
2. NameofOperator MUTIPLEWELLS
KERR-McGEEOIL & GAS ONSHORE LP 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No (include area code)
1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL, UT 84078 (435) 781-7024 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T.,R., M ,
or Survey Description)

I 1. County or Parish, State
SEE ATTACHED

UINTAHCOUNTY, UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, R3PORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent Q Acidize O Deepen Q Production (Start/Resume) O Water Shut-Off
O ^iter c.sing O Practure Treat O Recl===tion O wenIntestav

Subsequent Report Q Casing Repair O New Construction Q Recomplete Other CHANGE OF
O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon Q Temporarily Abandon OPERATOR

O Final Abandonment Notice O Convert to Injection O Plug Back Q Water Disposal

13. DescribeProposed or CompletedOperations(cleadystate all pertinentdetails,includingestimatedstartingdateof anypoposed work andapproximatedurationthereof
If the proposalis to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurfacelocationsand measuredandtrue vertical depths of all peltinentmarkers andzones.
Attach the Bondunder which the work will be performedor providethe BondNo. on file with BLM/BIA Requiredsubsequentreportsshallbe filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involvedoperations. If the operation osults in a multiple cornpletionor recompletionin a new interval,a Form31604 shallbe filedonce
testing has been completed. Final AbandonmentNotices shallbe filed only afta all requirements, includingoclamation, have been completed, and the operatorhasdeterminedthat the site isready for finalinspection.

PLEASE BE ADVISED THAT KERR-McGEE OIL &GAS ONSHORELP, IS CONSIDERED TO BE THE RECEIVEDOPERATOR OF THE ATTACHED WELL LOCATIONS. EFFECTIVE JANUARY 6, 2006.
KERR-McGEE OIL &GAS ONSHORE LP, IS RESPONSIBLE UNDER TERMS AND CONDITIONs MAYl 0 2006
OF THE LEASE(S) FOR THE OPERATIONS CONDUCTED UPON LEASE LANDS. BOND COVERAGE
IS PROVIDED BY STATE OF UTAH NATIONWIDEBOND NO. RLBOOO5237. Ï)IV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

ß Cm Bod d o/aos APPROVEDJUL6

Nat rinted/Typed) Title Earlene Russell,EngineeringTechnician
Y AY DRILLINGMANAGER

ture Date
May 9, 2006

f THIS SPACE FOR FEDERALOR STATEUSE
Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, ifany, are attached Approval of thisnotice doesnot warrant or Office
certify thatthe applicant holds Icgal or equitable title to thoserights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18U.S.C.Section 1001, make it a crime forany personknowinglyand willfullyto make to any departmentor agencyofthe UnitedStatesany
falæ, fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representationsas to anymatter withinitsjurisdiction.

(Instructions on



Form3160-5 UNITED STATES FOIW APPROVED
(August 1999) OMBNo. 1004.0135DEPARTMENT OF THEINTERIOR ExpiresJnovember30, 2000

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease serialNo.
SUNDRY NOTICESANDREPORTS ONWELLS MULTIPLELEASES

Do not use thls form for proposals to drlll or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned we/I, Use Form 3160-3 (APD)for such proposals.

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No,SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE- Other instructíons on reverse side
1. Type of Well

O oil wen U oaswell O Other 8. Well Name and No.
2. NameofOperator MUTIPLE WELLS
WESTPORT OIL &GAS COMPANYL.P. 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No, (include area code)
1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL, UT 84078 (435) 781-7024 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R., M., or Survey Description)

I 1. County or Parish, State
SEE ATTACHED

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, R IPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent Q Acidize O Deepen O Production (stanmesume)O Water Shut-Off
O Alter casing O Fracture Treat Q Reclamation Wel Integrity

Subsequent Report Q Casing Repair O New Construction O Recomplete Other CHANGE OF
O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon Q Temporarily Abandon OPERATORO Final Abandonment Notice O convento injection O Plug Back Q Water Disposal

13 DescribeProposedor CompletedOperations (clearly state all pertinent details,includingestimatedstarting date of any proposedworkand approximatedurationthereofIf the proposalis to deependirectionallyor recompletehorizontally,give subsurfacelocationsand measured and true vertical depths of all pertinentmarkers and zones.Attadi the Bond unde which the work will be performedor providethe BondNo. on filewith BLM/BIA Requiredsubsg¡uent reports shall be filed within 30 daysfollowingcompletionof the involvedoperations. If the opemtionn suits in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form3160-4shallbe filedoncetesting has been completed. Final AbandonmentNotios shallbe filed only after all requirements, includingreclamation, have been completed, and the opemtorhasdeterminedthat the site isreadyfor finalinspection.

EFFECTIVE JANUARY 6, 2006, WESTPORT OIL & GAS COMPANY L.P., HAS RELINQUISHED
THE OPERATORSHIP OF THE ATTACHED WELL LOCATIONS TO KERR-McGEE OIL & GAS
ONSHORE LP.

APPROVED <5 /h 06 REAYE
0

6D
Divisionof Oil,GasandMining
Earlene Russell, EngineeringTochniclas

-

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and cossect
Name (Printed/7pped) Title
BRAD LANEY ENGINEERING SPECIALIST
Signature Date

May 9, 2006
THIS SPACE FOR FEDERALOR STATE USE

Ap ved byg Title Date
MX $ Ÿ- O(.,pCorzijtionsof appio , are at Approval ofthis notice does not warrant or Office

certify thattit applicant holds leg equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001,makeit a crime forany personknowinglyand willfully to maketo any departmentor agencyof theUnitedStatesanyfalse,fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matterwithin itsjurisdiction.

(Instructions on
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KerrkGee

Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore LP
1368 South 1200 East Vernal Utah 84078

Telephone: 435-781-7024 Fax: 720-929-3616

August 26, 2009

43 097 30863
Dustin Doucet $Ô0
State of Utah gg gg Ç 2
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801
Salt Lake City, UT 84114

SUBJECT: Response to Letter Regarding Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned Well
Requirements for Fee or State Leases dated September 23, 2008

Dear Mr. Doucet:

Kerr McGee Oil and Gas (Kerr McGee) is responding to the Division of Oil, Gas and
Mining's request to bring the listed wells out of non-compliance status by September 1, 2009.
See Attachment A for the list of wells and our plan for each well. All wells will either be
plugged, recompleted, converted to SWD monitor wells, or have been returned to production.

Kerr McGee will be providing sundry notices and procedures within 60 days from this
notice. If you have any questions or need additional information in regards to the above please
contact Paul Wages at (435) 781 - 7037.

Regulatory Analyst

Enclosure

RECEIVED
AUG3 1 2009

OlV.0FOlL,GAS&
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ATTACHMENT A

Well Name API Plan
ClGE5 4304730335 P&A
CIGE 54D 4304730851 Already TA'd for SWD monitor well
ClGE 80D Tjas p go 4304730853 TA -- MonitorWell
CIGE 51D 4304730889 .P&A
NBU54N 4304730890 PS:A
ClGiE92D 4304731162 P8tA
NBU213-36J 4304731268 ECK3\¾ell
ARCHY BENCH STATE 1-2 4304731489 P&A
CIGE97D 4304731729 PSJr
NBU 157 4304732007 P8A
NBU343-36E ' 4304732205 ECK3VVell
NBU265 4304732796 P8/\
MORGAN STATE 12-36 4304732814 P&A
WONSITS STATE 1-32 9304732820P&A
NBU 333 4304733641 PBJr
NBU 389 4304734229 PSJr
STATE 921-32P 4304734422 TA for future SWD monitor well or
STYkTE920-36P Ã304734423P84\
NBU440 4304734785 TA -- MonitorWell
NBU442 4304734788 P&A
CIGE 284 43047347W n returned to production
CIGšE285 4304734793 P8JA
STATE920-360 43047357¾
NBU 1022-16G 4304735948 Currentlyproducing
NBU 1022-16B 4304736158 Currently producing
NBU921-34K 4304736389 AlreadyconvededtoS VDVVell
BONANZA 1023-16J 4304737092 Has surface hole only, extend TA

status to keep for future pad location
NBU 921-34J 4304737953 Extend TA status to evaluate for

I

RECEIVED
AU631 2009

DN.0F0\L,GAS&
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API Well No: 43047308530000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML-22652 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CIGE 80D 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047308530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0870 FNL 1018 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

5/17/2010

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 THE OPERATOR REQUESTS AUTHORIZATION TO PLUG AND ABANDON THE
SUBJECT WELL. THE OPERATION WILL INCLUDE SAMPLING THE BIRD'S NEST
FORMATION IN ORDER TO OBTAIN WATER SAMPLES. BASED ON THE WATER

SAMPLES, A DECISION WILL BE MADE ON WHETHER TO CONVERT THIS
WELL TO A SWD MONITOR WELL OR TO CONTINUE ON WITH THE PLUG AND
ABANDONMENT PROCEDURE. PLEASE SEE ATTACHED PLUG AND ABANDON

PROCUEDURE.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Andy Lytle

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 5/13/2010

PHONE NUMBER:
720 929-6007  Ext 

 

PHONE NUMBER
720 929-6100

May 13, 2010

June 08, 2010

iPI Well No: 43047308530000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING MLLEA2S2ED2ESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
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0870 FNL 1018 FWL
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Qtr/Qtr; NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.05 Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
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12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
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SUBJECT WELL. THE OPERATION WILL INCLUDE SAMPLING THE BIRD'S NEST Approved by the
FORMATION IN ORDER TO OBTAIN WATER SAMPLES. BASED ON THE WATER Utah Division of

SAMPLES, A DECISION WILL BE MADE ON WHETHER TO CONVERT THIS Oil, Gas and Mining
WELL TO A SWD MONITOR WELL OR TO CONTINUE ON WITH THE PLUG AND
ABANDONMENT PROCEDURE. PLEASE SEE ATTACHED PLUG AND ABANDOOate: Jun 08,, l¶

PROCUEDURE.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Andy Lytle 720 929-6100 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/13/2010

RECEIVED May 13,
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SUBJECT WELL. THE OPERATION WILL INCLUDE SAMPLING THE BIRD'S NEST Approved by the
FORMATION IN ORDER TO OBTAIN WATER SAMPLES. BASED ON THE WATER Utah Division of

SAMPLES, A DECISION WILL BE MADE ON WHETHER TO CONVERT THIS Oil, Gas and Mining
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NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Andy Lytle 720 929-6100 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/13/2010
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The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43047308530000

1. Notify the Division at least 24 hours prior to conducting abandonment operations.
Please call Dan Jarvis at 801-538-5338. 

2. If CBL does not show cement behind production casing for any of the proposed plugs,
the CICR shall be placed within 50’ of perfs. The same quantity of cement shall be

pumped to cover the intervals proposed. The amount pumped below and above will vary
based on the different setting depth of the CICR. 

3. All balanced plugs shall be tagged to ensure that they are at the depth specified. 

4. All annuli shall be cemented from a minimum depth of 100’ to the surface. 

5. Surface reclamation shall be done in accordance with R649-3-34 – Well Site
Restoration. 

6. All requirements in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-24 shall apply. 

7. If there are any changes to the procedure or the wellbore configuration, notify Dustin
Doucet at 801-538-5281 (ofc) or 801-733-0983 (home) prior to continuing with the

procedure. 

8. All other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation
General Rules shall apply. 
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6/8/2010 Wellbore Diagram r263

API Well No: 43-047-30853-00-00 Permit No: Well Name/No: CIGE 80D

Company Name: KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P.

Location: Sec: 2 T: 10S R: 21E Spot: NWNW String Information
Coordinates: X: 625981 Y: 4426693 Bottom Diameter Weight Length

String (ft sub) (inches) (Ib/ft) (ft)
Field Name: NATURAL BUTTES

HOLl 200 12.25
County Name: UINTAH SURF 200 9.625 36

HOL2 6008 7.875
PROD 6008 4.5 1l.6

Ut ^ 4
'

Cement from 200 ft. to surface 9 XL ( ©2 ) 2- 1 3 V
Surface: 9 625 in. @200 ft

Hole: 12.25 in. @200 ft

Cement Information

BOC TOC
String (ft sub) (ft sub) Class Sacks
PROD 6008 0 HG 710

PROD 6008 0 50 565

/ SURF 200 0 H 125

Perforation Information

Top Bottom
(ft sub) (ft sub) Shts/Ft No Shts Dt Squeeze
4793 5846

AU
a Dvsono

SO3 Lty) / Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: ( Jun 08,, l¶

h35 Joo ormation Information

9
s¯40 LL Formation Depth

CtG L(† UNTA 0
-· GRRV 1430

IJS) (if,t/ TRONA 1685

'MHGBN 2071
PARCK 3035

Cement from 6008 it to surface SW 3593
Production: 4.5 in. @6008 ft WSTC 4540

Hole: 7.875 in. @6008 ft.

T I: 6008 TVD: PBTD:
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CIGE 80 D 
870’ FNL & 1018’ FWL 
NWNW SEC.2, T10S, R21E 
Uintah County, UT 
 
 
KBE: 5093’     API NUMBER:  43-047-30853 
GLE: 5080’’     LEASE NUMBER: ML – 22652 
TD: 6008’     WI:   100.0000% 
PBTD: 5963’ (FC)    NRI:   78.952950% 
 5750’ (CIBP)   
 
CASING: 12 ¼” hole 

9 5/8” 36# K-55 @ 200’ (GL) 
Cemented w/ 125 sx, class H, TOC @ Surface. 
 
7.875” hole 
4.5” 11.6# N-80 @ 6008’.   
Cemented w/ 710 sx Hi-Fill lead and 565 sx 50-50 Pozmix tail. TOC @ surface (from file 
3/6/81) 

 
TUBING: 2.375” 4.7# K-55 tubing landed at 4670’  
 

Capacities Tubular/Borehole Drift 
inches 

Collapse 
psi 

Burst 
Psi Gal./ft. Cuft/ft. Bbl./ft. 

2.375” 4.7# K-55 tbg. 1.901 8100 7700 0.1624 0.02173 0.00387 
4.5” 11.6# N-80 3.875 6350 7780 0.6528 0.0872 0.0155 
9.625” 36# K-55 8.921 2020 3520 3.2470 0.4340 0.0773 
Annular Capacities 
2.375” tbg. X 4 ½” 11.6# csg 0.4227 0.0565 0.01006 
4.5” csg X 9 5/8” 36# csg 2.2159 0.3231 0.0576 
4.5” csg X 7.875 borehole 1.7040 0.2276 0.0406 
9.625” csg X 12 1/4” borehole 2.3436 0.3132 0.0558 
 
 
GEOLOGIC INFORMATION: 
 
Formation   Depth to top, ft. 
Uinta    Surface 
Green River   1417’ 
Bird’s Nest   1685’ 
Mahogany   2071’ 
Parachute Member  3035’ 
Wasatch   4668’    
 
 
Tech. Pub. #92 Base of USDW’s 
USDW Elevation  1500’ MSL 
USDW Depth   3593’ KBE 
 
 
 

May 13, 2010

CIGE 80 D
870' FNL & 1018' FWL
NWNWSEC.2, T10S, R21E
Uintah County, UT
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PERFORATIONS: 
Formation Date Top SPF Status 
Wasatch Mar-81 4793 1 Open 
Wasatch Mar-81 4796 1 Open 
Wasatch Mar-81 4799 1 Open 
Wasatch Mar-81 5500 1 Open 
Wasatch Mar-81 5518 1 Open 
Wasatch Mar-81 5522 1 Open 
Wasatch Mar-81 5587 1 Open 
Wasatch Mar-81 5631 1 Open 
Wasatch Mar-81 5639 1 Open 
Wasatch Mar-81 5798 1 Excluded 
Wasatch Mar-81 5804 1 Excluded 
Wasatch Mar-81 5838 1 Excluded 
Wasatch Mar-81 5842 1 Excluded 
Wasatch Mar-81 5846 1 Excluded 
 
 
 
WELL HISTORY: 
 
Completion – March 1981 

• Perforated the gross Wasatch interval 4793’ through 5846’.  Landed tubing at 4612’. 
• Broke down with 67 bbl 5% KCl and ball sealers. 
• Fractured with 2143 bbl gel containing 180000# 20/40 sand. 
• Tested 650 MCFD, 0 BCPD, 0 BWPD, 450 psi FTP, 550 SICP, 16/64th choke on 3/31/1981. 

 
Workover #1 – January 1991 

• Ran a fluid entry log with water coming from below fill at 5797’. 
• Cleaned out fill to PBTD, landed tubing at 4670’ and RTP. 
• Ran another fluid entry log with water indicated from 5798’ and 5804’. 
• Set CIBP at 5814’, CICR at 5682’, squeezed with 12 bbl Class G cement. 
• Drilled out to CIBP, ran packer and pressure tested squeeze to 500 psi. 
• Drilled out CIBP and cleaned out to 5940’.  Landed tubing at 4679’. 
• Well would not kick off after several days of swabbing.  Set RBP at 4903’ and acidized 

perforations 4793’ through 4799’ with 10 bbl 7.5% HCl. 
• Landed tubing at 4670’ and RTP. 

 
Workover #2 – August 1997 

• Cleaned out to 5758’ and set CIBP at 5750’ to excluded bottom perforations. 
• Landed tubing at 5638’ and RTP. 
• Appears that the well did not kick off after swabbing. 
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CIGE 80D PROCEDURE 
 

GENERAL 
 

• H2S MAY BE PRESENT.  CHECK FOR H2S AND TAKE APPROPRIATE PRECAUTIONS. 
• CEMENT QUANTITIES BELOW ASSUME NEAT CLASS G, YIELD 1.145 CUFT./SX.  IF A DIFFERENT PRODUCT 

IS USED, WELLSITE PERSONNEL ARE RESONSIBLE FOR CORRECTING QUANTITIES TO YIELD THE STATED 
SLURRY VOLUME.  WHEN SQUEEZING, INCLUDE 10% EXCESS PER 1000’ OF DEPTH. 

• BRINE WITH A MINIMUM DENSITY OF AT LEAST 9 PPG MUST BE PLACED BETWEEN ALL PLUGS.  10 PPG 
IS ASSUMED IN THIS PROCEDURE. 

• ALL DISPLACEMENT FLUID SHALL CONTAIN CORROSION INHIBITOR AND BIOCIDE.  PREMIX 5 GALLSONS 
PER 100 BBLS FLUID. 

• NOTIFY UDOGM 24 HOURS BEFORE MOVING ON LOCATION. 
 
PROCEDURE 
 
Note:  An estimated 159x Class “G” cement needed for procedure 
Note:  Gyro ran to 5081’  
 

1. MIRU.  KILL WELL AS NEEDED.  ND WH, NU AND TEST BOPE. 
 

2. PULL TBG & LD SAME.  RU WIRELINE AND MAKE A GAUGE RING RUN TO CHECK FOR FILL. 
 

3. RUN CBL (WITH PRESSURE IF NEED BE) TO CONFIRM TOC @ SURFACE (NO CBL IN WELL FILE OR IN 
STATE DATABASE).   
NOTE:  PROCEDURE IS WRITTEN ASSUMING TOC TO SURFACE. 

 
4. PLUG #1, ISOLATE WASATCH PERFORATIONS (4793’ – 5846’) & PROTECT WASATCH TOP (4668’):  RIH 

W/ 4 ½” CIBP.  SET @ ~4743’.  RELEASE CIBP, BRK CIRC W/ FRESH WATER.  DISPLACE 13 SX (15.26 
CUFT.) ON TOP OF PLUG.  PUH ABOVE TOC (~4568’, 175’ COVERAGE).  REVERSE CIRCULATE W/ 10 PPG 
BRINE. 

 
5. PLUG #2, PROTECT USDW (~3593) & BASE OF PARACHUTE MEMBER (~3035’):  PUH TO ~3693’.  BRK 

CIRC W/ FRESH WATER.  DISPLACE 58 SX (66.10 CUFT.) AND BALANCE PLUG W/ TOC @ ~2935’ (758’ 
COVERAGE).  PUH ABOVE TOC.  REVERSE CIRCULATE W/ 10 PPG BRINE. 

 
a. IF CBL DOES NOT CONFIRM CEMENT BEHIND PRODUCTION CASING, PROCEED AS FOLLOWS:  

POOH W/ TBG.  RIH W/ WIRELINE, PERFORATE @ ~3693’ W/ 4 SPF.  PU & RIH W/ 4 ½” CICR, 
SET @ ~2935’.  RIH W/ TBG & STING INTO CICR & SQUEEZE PERFS W/ APPROXIMATELY 322.14 
CUFT. (~281 SX, CALCULATION INCLUDES 35% EXCESS) OR SUFFICIENT VOLUME TO FILL CSG & 
BOREHOLE ANNULUS TO 2935’.  STING OUT OF CICR AND SPOT 4 SX (4.36.) CMT ON TOP OF 
CICR.  BRK CIRC W/ FRESH WATER.  POOH ABOVE TOC (~2885’).  REVERSE CIRCULATE W/ 10 
PPG BRINE.   

 
6. PLUG #3, PROTECT MAHOGANY TOP (2071’):  PUH TO ~2171’.  BRK CIRC W/ FRESH WATER.  DISPLACE 

17.44 CUFT. (~15 SX) AND BALANCE PLUG W/ TOC @ ~1971’ (200’ COVERAGE).  PUH ABOVE TOC.  
REVERSE CIRCULATE W/ 10 PPG BRINE. 

 
a. IF CBL DOES NOT CONFIRM CEMENT BEHIND PRODUCTION CASING, PROCEED AS FOLLOWS:  

POOH W/ TBG.  RIH W/ WIRELINE, PERFORATE @ ~2171’ W/ 4 SPF.  PU & RIH W/ 4 ½” CICR, 
SET @ ~1971’.  RIH W/ TBG & STING INTO CICR & SQUEEZE PERFS W/ APPROXIMATELY 75.56 
CUFT. (~66 SX, CALCULATION INCLUDES 20% EXCESS) OR SUFFICIENT VOLUME TO FILL CSG & 
BOREHOLE ANNULUS TO 1971’.  STING OUT OF CICR AND SPOT 4 SX (4.36.) CMT ON TOP OF 
CICR.  BRK CIRC W/ FRESH WATER.  POOH ABOVE TOC (~1921’).  REVERSE CIRCULATE W/ 10 
PPG BRINE.  (IF YOU CAN GET FLUID RETURNS OT SURFACE PUMP A LIGHTWEIGHT LEAD AND A 
“G” TAIL CEMENT TO GET AT LEAST 500’ ABOVE THE TOP OF THE GREEN RIVER.  POOH.) 
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CIGE 80D PROCEDURE
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• H2S MAYBE PRESENT. CHECK FOR H2S AND TAKEAPPROPRIATE PRECAUTIONS.
• CEMENT QUANTITIESBELOWASSUME NEATCLASS G, YlELD 1.145 CUFT./SX. IF A DIFFERENT PRODUCT
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"G" TAILCEMENT TO GET AT LEAST500' ABOVETHE TOP OF THE GREEN RIVER. POOH.)
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7. Birds Nest Sampling:  SEE ATTACHED BIRD’S NEST WATER SAMPLING PROCEDURE TO OBTAIN A WATER 
SAMPLE FROM 1835’-1845’.  BASED ON THE WATER SAMPLES, A DECISION WILL BE MADE ON 
WHETHER TO CONVERT THE WELL TO A SWD MONITORING WELL OR TO CONTINUE ON WITH THE P&A 
PROCEDURE. 

 
8. PLUG #4, PROTECT BIRD’S NEST TOP (1685’), AND GREEN RIVER TOP (1417’):  PUH TO ~1785’.  BRK 

CIRC W/ FRESH WATER.  DISPLACE 40.81 CUFT. (~36 SX) AND BALANCE PLUG W/ TOC @ ~1317’ (468’ 
COVERAGE).  PUH ABOVE TOC.  REVERSE CIRCULATE W/ 10 PPG BRINE. 

 
a. IF CBL DOES NOT CONFIRM CEMENT BEHIND PRODUCTION CASING, PROCEED AS FOLLOWS:  

POOH W/ TBG.  RIH W/ WIRELINE, PERFORATE @ ~1785’ W/ 4 SPF.  PU & RIH W/ 4 ½” CICR, 
SET @ ~1317’.  RIH W/ TBG & STING INTO CICR & SQUEEZE PERFS W/ APPROXIMATELY 169.43 
CUFT. (~148 SX, CALCULATION INCLUDES 15% EXCESS) OR SUFFICIENT VOLUME TO FILL CSG & 
BOREHOLE ANNULUS TO 1317’.  STING OUT OF CICR AND SPOT 4 SX (4.36.) CMT ON TOP OF 
CICR.  BRK CIRC W/ FRESH WATER.  POOH ABOVE TOC (~1267’).  REVERSE CIRCULATE W/ 10 
PPG BRINE.   

 
9. PLUG #4, SURFACE SHOE (213’ KB) & SURFACE HOLE:  PUH TO 300’.  BRK CIRC W/ FRESH WATER.  

DISPLACE 23 SX (26.16 CUFT.) OR SUFFICIENT VOLUME TO FILL 4 ½” CSG TO SURFACE.   
 

a. IF CBL DOES NOT CONFIRM CEMENT BEHIND PRODUCTION CASING, PROCEED AS FOLLOWS:  
POOH W/ TBG.  RIH W/ WIRELINE, PERFORATE @ ~300’ W/ 4 SPF.  POOH W/ WIRELINE.  RU 
CEMENT SERVICE TO PROD CSG.  PUMP A MINIMUM OF 123.09 CUFT. (~108 SXS) OR 
SUFFICIENT VOLUME TO FILL ANNULUS AND CASING TO SURFACE.   

 
10. CUT OFF WELLHEAD AND INSTALL MARKER PER BLM GUIDELINES. 

 
11. RDMO.  TURN OVER TO OPERATIONS FOR SURFACE REHAB. 

 
ALM 5/11/10 
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7. Birds Nest Sampling: SEE ATTACHEDBIRD'S NEST WATERSAMPLING PROCEDURE TO OBTAINA WATER
SAMPLE FROM 1835'-1845'. BASED ON THE WATER SAMPLES, A DECISION WILL BE MADE ON
WHETHER TO CONVERT THE WELL TO A SWD MONITORINGWELL OR TO CONTINUE ON WITH THE P&A
PROCEDURE.

8. PLUG#4, PROTECT BIRD'S NEST TOP (1685'), AND GREEN RIVER TOP (141T): PUH TO ~1785'. BRK
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SET @ ~1317'. RIH W/ TBG & STING INTOCICR & SQUEEZE PERFS W/ APPROXIMATELY169.43
CUFT. (~148 SX, CALCULATIONINCLUDES 15% EXCESS) OR SUFFICIENT VOLUMETO FILLCSG &
BOREHOLE ANNULUS TO 131T. STING OUT OF CICR AND SPOT 4 SX (4.36.) CMT ON TOP OF
CICR. BRK CIRC W/ FRESH WATER. POOH ABOVETOC (~1267'). REVERSE CIRCULATEW/ 10
PPG BRINE.

9. PLUG#4, SURFACE SHOE (213' KB) & SURFACE HOLE: PUH TO 300'. BRK CIRC W/ FRESH WATER.
DISPLACE 23 SX (26.16 CUFT.) OR SUFFICIENTVOLUMETO FILL4 ½" CSG TO SURFACE.

a. IF CBL DOES NOT CONFIRM CEMENT BEHIND PRODUCTION CASING, PROCEED AS FOLLOWS:
POOH W/ TBG. RIH W/ WIRELINE, PERFORATE @ ~300' W/ 4 SPF. POOH W/ WIRELINE. RU
CEMENT SERVICE TO PROD CSG. PUMP A MINIMUM OF 123.09 CUFT. (~108 SXS) OR
SUFFICIENTVOLUMETO FILLANNULUSAND CASINGTO SURFACE.

10. CUT OFF WELLHEADAND INSTALLMARKER PER BLM GUIDELINES.

11. RDMO. TURN OVERTO OPERATIONS FOR SURFACE REHAB.
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a. IF CBL DOES NOT CONFIRM CEMENT BEHIND PRODUCTION CASING, PROCEED AS FOLLOWS:
POOH W/ TBG. RIH W/ WIRELINE, PERFORATE @ ~300' W/ 4 SPF. POOH W/ WIRELINE. RU
CEMENT SERVICE TO PROD CSG. PUMP A MINIMUM OF 123.09 CUFT. (~108 SXS) OR
SUFFICIENTVOLUMETO FILLANNULUSAND CASINGTO SURFACE.

10. CUT OFF WELLHEADAND INSTALLMARKER PER BLM GUIDELINES.

11. RDMO. TURN OVERTO OPERATIONS FOR SURFACE REHAB.
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INJECTION ZONE WATER SAMPLING FOR SWD WELLS 
 
 
 
 

1. If workover fluid has been pumped into the well for corrective action requirements (i.e. 
squeeze work, RAT’s test, etc) near the proposed injection interval, get an accurate record of 
the volume pumped to account for and also obtain a sample of the workover fluid for 
reference purposes. 

2. RIH with tubing to the ±top of the proposed perforated interval (1835’).  Rig up swab 
equipment and swab the fluid level to 500’ above proposed perforated interval so the well 
can be perforated under-balanced. 

3. POOH with the tubing 
4. RIH and under-balance perforate the proposed interval (1835’-1845’) with the appropriate 

sized guns.  POOH with the perforating guns. 
5. RIH with tubing to the ±top of the perforated interval 
6. R/U to Swab or Nitrogen lift the well to get a representative fluid sample of the injection 

interval.  NOTE:  It may be necessary to break-down and/or acidize the perforations in order 
obtain adequate fluid entry into the wellbore. 

a. Have a chemical company representative on location to take regular samples and 
monitor chlorides, potassium, and pH of the water. 

b. Document field readings of Load Water Volume to Recover, Time, Volume of Fluid 
Recovered, Chlorides, pH during the entire field sampling process.  (See Attached 
Table.) 

c. Continue Swabbing or nitrogen lifting the well until all fluid that has been put into 
the well from corrective action operations has been accounted for.   
NOTE: A minimum of twice the volume of load water will be produced back from 
the well prior to sampling. 

d. Once the chlorides, potassium, and pH have stabilized and look to be representative 
of the injection zone interval, take three last successive samples (plus selected 
previous samples for comparisons) in for complete water analysis to measure for 
TDS, pH, SG, and conductivity. 

e. Collect one additional sample and put into a provided bottle to be sent off to check 
for the presence of Naturally Occurring Hydrocarbons (as per instructions from 
Humble Geochemical Services). 

f. Continue to stay rigged up and wait for the water analysis to come back to confirm 
that the samples show a stabilized TDS, pH, SG, and conductivity.  If samples show 
consistency, consider the samples to be representative of the injection zone water, 
otherwise continue to resample. 
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consistency, consider the samples to be representative of the injection zone water,
otherwise continue to resample.

RECEIVED May 13,

INJECTION ZONE WATER SAMPLING FOR SWD WELLS

1. If workover fluid has been pumped into the well for corrective action requirements (i.e.
squeeze work, RAT's test, etc) near the proposed injection interval, get an accurate record of
the volume pumped to account for and also obtain a sample of the workover fluid for
reference purposes.

2. RIH with tubing to the ±top of the proposed perforated interval (1835'). Rig up swab
equipment and swab the fluid level to 500' above proposed perforated interval so the well
can be perforated under-balanced.

3. POOH with the tubing
4. RIH and under-balance perforate the proposed interval (1835'-1845') with the appropriate

sized guns. POOH with the perforating guns.
5. RIH with tubing to the ±top of the perforated interval
6. R/U to Swab or Nitrogen lift the well to get a representative fluid sample of the injection

interval. NOTE: It may be necessary to break-down and/or acidize the perforations in order
obtain adequate fluid entry into the wellbore.

a. Have a chemical company representative on location to take regular samples and
monitor chlorides, potassium, and pH of the water.

b. Document field readings of Load Water Volume to Recover, Time, Volume of Fluid
Recovered, Chlorides, pH during the entire field sampling process. (See Attached
Table.)

c. Continue Swabbing or nitrogen lifting the well until all fluid that has been put into
the well from corrective action operations has been accounted for.
NOTE: A minimum of twice the volume of load water will be produced back from
the well prior to sampling.

d. Once the chlorides, potassium, and pH have stabilized and look to be representative
of the injection zone interval, take three last successive samples (plus selected
previous samples for comparisons) in for complete water analysis to measure for
TDS, pH, SG, and conductivity.

e. Collect one additional sample and put into a provided bottle to be sent off to check
for the presence of Naturally Occurring Hydrocarbons (as per instructions from
Humble Geochemical Services).

f. Continue to stay rigged up and wait for the water analysis to come back to confirm
that the samples show a stabilized TDS, pH, SG, and conductivity. If samples show
consistency, consider the samples to be representative of the injection zone water,
otherwise continue to resample.

RECEIVED May 13,

INJECTION ZONE WATER SAMPLING FOR SWD WELLS

1. If workover fluid has been pumped into the well for corrective action requirements (i.e.
squeeze work, RAT's test, etc) near the proposed injection interval, get an accurate record of
the volume pumped to account for and also obtain a sample of the workover fluid for
reference purposes.

2. RIH with tubing to the ±top of the proposed perforated interval (1835'). Rig up swab
equipment and swab the fluid level to 500' above proposed perforated interval so the well
can be perforated under-balanced.

3. POOH with the tubing
4. RIH and under-balance perforate the proposed interval (1835'-1845') with the appropriate

sized guns. POOH with the perforating guns.
5. RIH with tubing to the ±top of the perforated interval
6. R/U to Swab or Nitrogen lift the well to get a representative fluid sample of the injection

interval. NOTE: It may be necessary to break-down and/or acidize the perforations in order
obtain adequate fluid entry into the wellbore.

a. Have a chemical company representative on location to take regular samples and
monitor chlorides, potassium, and pH of the water.

b. Document field readings of Load Water Volume to Recover, Time, Volume of Fluid
Recovered, Chlorides, pH during the entire field sampling process. (See Attached
Table.)

c. Continue Swabbing or nitrogen lifting the well until all fluid that has been put into
the well from corrective action operations has been accounted for.
NOTE: A minimum of twice the volume of load water will be produced back from
the well prior to sampling.

d. Once the chlorides, potassium, and pH have stabilized and look to be representative
of the injection zone interval, take three last successive samples (plus selected
previous samples for comparisons) in for complete water analysis to measure for
TDS, pH, SG, and conductivity.

e. Collect one additional sample and put into a provided bottle to be sent off to check
for the presence of Naturally Occurring Hydrocarbons (as per instructions from
Humble Geochemical Services).

f. Continue to stay rigged up and wait for the water analysis to come back to confirm
that the samples show a stabilized TDS, pH, SG, and conductivity. If samples show
consistency, consider the samples to be representative of the injection zone water,
otherwise continue to resample.

RECEIVED May 13,



Well Name ____________________________________________________________ 
 
Location ____________________________________________________________ 
 
Date _________________________ Formation ________________________ 
 
Perforated Interval _____________ Load Water Volume __________________ 
 
 
 

Time Cumulative 
Volume 

Recovered 

Load Left to 
Recover 

Chlorides Ph Potassium 

      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
      
 
 

 

 
 
 

May 13, 2010

Well Name

Location

Date Formation

Perforated Interval Load Water Volume

Time Cumulative Load Left to Chlorides Ph Potassium
Volume Recover

Recovered

RECEIVED May 13,

Well Name

Location

Date Formation

Perforated Interval Load Water Volume

Time Cumulative Load Left to Chlorides Ph Potassium
Volume Recover

Recovered

RECEIVED May 13,

Well Name

Location

Date Formation

Perforated Interval Load Water Volume

Time Cumulative Load Left to Chlorides Ph Potassium
Volume Recover

Recovered

RECEIVED May 13,



 

M
ay 13, 2010

R
EC

EIV
ED

M
ay

13,
R

EC
EIV

ED
M

ay
13,

R
EC

EIV
ED

M
ay

13,



API Well No: 43047308530000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML-22652 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CIGE 80D 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047308530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6007  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0870 FNL 1018 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

7/19/2010

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: SWD MONITOR CONVERSION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 THE OPERATOR HAS CONCLUDED THE DOWNHOLE PLUGGING OPERATIONS
OF THIS WELL'S PRODUCING FORMATIONS (WASATCH). THE OPERATOR HAS

PERFORATED THE BIRD'S NEST FORMATION AND WATER SAMPLES WERE
TAKEN AND ANALYZED. THIS WELL HAS NOW BEEN CONVERTED TO A SWD
MONITOR WELL. PER RECOMENDATION OF THE OPERATOR AND THE EPA,

THIS WELL IS BEING CONVERTED TO A SWD MONITOR WELL IN ORDER TO
MONITOR INJECTION INTO THE BIRD'S NEST FORMATION. THE OPERATOR
REQUESTS THAT THE FINAL PLUG AND ABANDONMENT OPERATIONS BE

POSTPONED UNTIL MONITORING OPERATIONS ARE COMPLETE. PLEASE SEE
THE ATTACHED CHRONOLOGICAL WELL HISTORY.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Andy Lytle 720 929-6100

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 8/26/2010

August 26, 2010

September 09, 2010

iPI Well No: 43047308530000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING LLEA2S2E65D2ESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. NATURAL BUTTES

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well CIGE 80D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
KERR-MCGEE OIL&GAS ONSHORE,L.P. 43047308530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6007 Ext NATURAL BUTTES

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0870 FNL 1018 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.05 Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

7/19/2010 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

sPuD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

O DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: SWD MONITOR CON

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

THE OPERATOR HAS CONCLUDED THE DOWNHOLE PLUGGING OPERATIONS
OF THIS WELL'S PRODUCING FORMATIONS (WASATCH). THE OPERATOR HAS Approved by the

PERFORATED THE BIRD'S NEST FORMATION AND WATER SAMPLES WERE Utah Division of
TAKEN AND ANALYZED. THIS WELL HAS NOW BEEN CONVERTED TO A SWD Oil, Gas and Mining

MONITOR WELL. PER RECOMENDATION OF THE OPERATOR AND THE EPA,
THIS WELL IS BEING CONVERTED TO A SWD MONITOR WELL IN ORDER TDate: Se embefDP,2010

,

MONITOR INJECTION INTO THE BIRD'S NEST FORMATION. THE OPERATOR
REQUESTS THAT THE FINAL PLUG AND ABANDONMENT OPERATIONS BEgy:

POSTPONED UNTIL MONITORING OPERATIONS ARE COMPLETE. PLEASE SEE
THE ATTACHED CHRONOLOGICAL WELL HISTORY.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Andy Lytle 720 929-6100 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 8/26/2010

RECEIVED August 26,
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12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
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PERFORATED THE BIRD'S NEST FORMATION AND WATER SAMPLES WERE Utah Division of
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FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
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11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
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ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
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TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

O DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: SWD MONITOR CON

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

THE OPERATOR HAS CONCLUDED THE DOWNHOLE PLUGGING OPERATIONS
OF THIS WELL'S PRODUCING FORMATIONS (WASATCH). THE OPERATOR HAS Approved by the

PERFORATED THE BIRD'S NEST FORMATION AND WATER SAMPLES WERE Utah Division of
TAKEN AND ANALYZED. THIS WELL HAS NOW BEEN CONVERTED TO A SWD Oil, Gas and Mining

MONITOR WELL. PER RECOMENDATION OF THE OPERATOR AND THE EPA,
THIS WELL IS BEING CONVERTED TO A SWD MONITOR WELL IN ORDER TDate: Se embefDP,2010

,

MONITOR INJECTION INTO THE BIRD'S NEST FORMATION. THE OPERATOR
REQUESTS THAT THE FINAL PLUG AND ABANDONMENT OPERATIONS BEgy:

POSTPONED UNTIL MONITORING OPERATIONS ARE COMPLETE. PLEASE SEE
THE ATTACHED CHRONOLOGICAL WELL HISTORY.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Andy Lytle 720 929-6100 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 8/26/2010

RECEIVED August 26,



US ROCKIES REGION

Operation Summary Report
Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date: 

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD End Date: 7/19/2010Start Date: 7/8/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft (above Mean Sea Level) UWI: CIGE 80D

     Time     
Start-End

MD From
(ft)

Code Sub 
Code

P/U OperationPhaseDuration
(hr)

Date

7/8/2010 WO/REP 30 A P ROAD RIG AND EQUIP FROM NBU 921-33O TO 
LOCATION. FTP 50, FCP 50. BWD TO PROD TANK. 
SPOT AND RUSU. ND WH. NU BOP. RU FLOOR 
AND TBG EQUIP. PU ON TBG. TBG STUCK. 
WORKING TBG FROM STRING WT TO 50K WHEN 
TBG PARTED. ST WT 15K NOW. RU PRS.

2.0011:00 9:00 -

WO/REP 31 I P SCAN AND SORT AS POOH W/ 131 JTS 2-3/8" J-55 
TBG. ALL JTS RED BAND. ID PITTING AND WALL 
LOSS. JT #131 HAS PARTED PIN. FISH IS TBG 
CPLG W/ DUTCHMAN AT 4063'. RD PRS AND 
SDFN.

5.0016:0011:00 -

7/9/2010 WO/REP 48 P JSA- FISHING TBG0.25 6:45 6:30 -
WO/REP 31 I X SICP 300. BWD. MU 3-3/4" OVERSHOT (3-1/16" GR, 

2-3/4" STOP) AND RIH AS MEAS AND PU 2-3/8" 
J-55 TBG. TAG AND LATCH ONTO FISH AT 4081' 
W/ 128-JTS IN. WORK TBG 0-50K. NO SUCCESS.

2.25 9:00 6:45 -

WO/REP 34 A X RU CASEDHOLE AND RIH W/ 1-11/16" SPUD ASSY.
THRU OVERSHOT AT 4081' DOWN TO SET DOWN 
AT 5746'. LOOKS LIKE 50-JTS, SN, 1-JT, NC W/ 
EOT AT 5652'. RIH W/ FREEPOINT TOOLS. 
READING AT 4800' SHOWED 50% FREE, 4750' 
SHOWED 100% FREE. CONFIRM W/ STATE TO 
CUT TBG 4750' (1ST CIBP TO BE SET AT 4743'). 
RIH W/ 1-11/16" CHEM CUT AND CUT TBG OFF AT 
4758'. CUT CLEAN. RD CASEDHOLE.

2.5011:30 9:00 -

WO/REP 31 I X POOH W/ 128-JTS AND OVERSHOT. RECOVERED 
21-JTS AND CUT. (TOTAL OF 152-JTS AND CUT, 
TOF AT 4754')

2.0013:3011:30 -

WO/REP 34 I P RIH W/ 4-1/2" CIBP. SET DOWN ON FISH TOP. PU 
4' AND SET AT 4750'. POOH. FILL HOLE W/ 40 
BBLS AND P-TEST TO 1000#. GOOD. RIH W/ 
GR/CBL/CCL AND CORROLATE TO OH. SET 
DOWN ON CIBP AT 4740' (EWL) LOG UP TO 4000' 
W/O PRESSURE. REPEAT FROM 4740' TO 
SURFACE W/ 1000#. GOOD CMT ACROSS BIRDS 
NEST AND TOC AT 220'. RD CASEDHOLE. SDFN

4.0017:3013:30 -

7/12/2010 WO/REP 48 P JSA- TRIPPING TBG. LD TBG.0.25 6:45 6:30 -
WO/REP 31 I P RIH W/ NOTCHED 1.87" XN AND 149-JTS. EOT AT 

4740'.
1.25 8:00 6:45 -

WO/REP 51 D P RU PRO PETRO. PMP 15 SX CMT PLUG #1 
4543'-4740'. SPOT BRINE. PULL UP HOLE. PMP 60 
SX CMT PLUG #2 2903'-3700' AND SPOT BRINE. 
PULL UP HOLE. PMP 20 SX CMT PLUG #3 
1968'-2194'. PULL UP TO 1968 AND REV HOLE 
CLEAN W/ FRESH WTR. 1/2 BBL CMT BACK. RD 
PRO PETRO.

2.0010:00 8:00 -

WO/REP 31 I P POOH W/ 62-JTS 2-3/8" J-55 TBG. FILL CSG W/ 3 
BBL TMAC. CLEAN LOCATION. SDFN

4.5014:3010:00 -

7/13/2010 WO/REP 48 P JSA- LOGGING. TRIPPING PIPE. SWABBING.0.25 6:45 6:30 -
WO/REP 41 C P SICP 0. MIRU PLS. RUN TEMP LOG FROM 

SURFACE TO SET DOWN AT 1964'. RD PLS
2.25 9:00 6:45 -

WO/REP 31 I P MU AND RIH W/ NOTCHED XN NIPPLE ON 62-JTS 
2-3/8" J-55 TBG. RU TO SWAB

0.50 9:30 9:00 -

WO/REP 42 B P MAKE 5 SWAB RUNS. IFL SURFACE. FFL 1200' 
PULLED 18.6 BBLS FLUID. 6.9 BBLS FLUID LEFT. 
(FLUID LEVEL 1400')

1.0010:30 9:30 -

WO/REP 31 I P POOH W/ 62-JTS TBG. ND STRIPPING HEAD1.0011:3010:30 -
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August 26, 2010August 26, 2010

US ROCKIES REGION

Operation Summary Report
Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date:

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD Start Date: 7/8/2010 End Date: 7/19/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft(above Mean Sea Level) UWl: CIGE 80D

Date Time Duration Phase Code Sub P/U MD From Operation
Start-End (hr) Code (ft)

7/8/2010 9:00 - 11:00 2.00 WOIREP 30 A P ROAD RIG AND EQUIP FROM NBU 921-330 TO
LOCATION. FTP 50, FCP 50. BWD TO PROD TANK.
SPOT AND RUSU. ND WH. NU BOP. RU FLOOR
AND TBG EQUIP. PU ON TBG. TBG STUCK.
WORKING TBG FROM STRING WT TO 50K WHEN
TBG PARTED. ST WT 15K NOW. RU PRS.

11:00 - 16:00 5.00 WOIREP 31 I P SCAN AND SORT AS POOH W/ 131 JTS 2-3/8" J-55
TBG. ALL JTS RED BAND. ID PITTING AND WALL
LOSS. JT #131 HAS PARTED PIN. FISH IS TBG
CPLG WI DUTCHMAN AT 4063'. RD PRS AND
SDFN.

7/9/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- FISHING TBG
6:45 - 9:00 2.25 WOIREP 31 I X SICP 300. BWD. MU 3-3/4" OVERSHOT (3-1/16" GR,

2-3/4" STOP) AND RIH AS MEAS AND PU2-3/8"
J-55 TBG. TAG AND LATCH ONTO FISH AT 4081'
WI 128-JTS IN. WORK TBG 0-50K. NO SUCCESS.

9:00 - 11:30 2.50 WOIREP 34 A X RU CASEDHOLE AND RIH WI 1-11/16" SPUD ASSY.
THRU OVERSHOT AT 4081' DOWN TO SET DOWN
AT 5746'. LOOKS LIKE50-JTS, SN, 1-JT, NC W/
EOT AT 5652'. RIH W/ FREEPOINT TOOLS.
READING AT 4800' SHOWED 50% FREE, 4750'
SHOWED 100% FREE. CONFIRM W/ STATE TO
CUT TBG 4750' (1ST CIBP TO BE SET AT 4743').
RIH W/ 1-11/16" CHEM CUT AND CUT TBG OFF AT
4758'. CUT CLEAN. RD CASEDHOLE.

11:30 - 13:30 2.00 WOIREP 31 I X POOH W/ 128-JTS AND OVERSHOT. RECOVERED
21-JTS AND CUT. (TOTAL OF 152-JTS AND CUT,
TOF AT 4754')

13:30 - 17:30 4.00 WOIREP 34 I P RIH Wl4-1/2" CIBP. SET DOWN ON FISH TOP. PU
4' AND SET AT 4750'. POOH. FILL HOLE W/ 40
BBLS AND P-TEST TO 1000#. GOOD. RIH WI
GR/CBL/CCL AND CORROLATE TO OH. SET
DOWN ON CIBP AT 4740' (EWL) LOG UP TO 4000'
WlO PRESSURE. REPEAT FROM 4740' TO
SURFACE W/ 1000#. GOOD CMT ACROSS BIRDS
NEST AND TOC AT 220'. RD CASEDHOLE. SDFN

7/12/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- TRIPPING TBG. LD TBG.
6:45 - 8:00 1.25 WOIREP 31 I P RIH W/ NOTCHED 1.87" XN AND 149-JTS. EOT AT

4740'.
8:00 - 10:00 2.00 WOIREP 51 D P RU PRO PETRO. PMP 15 SX CMT PLUG #1

4543'-4740'. SPOT BRINE. PULL UP HOLE. PMP 60
SX CMT PLUG #2 2903'-3700' AND SPOT BRINE.
PULL UP HOLE. PMP20 SX CMT PLUG #3
1968'-2194'. PULL UP TO 1968 AND REV HOLE
CLEAN W/ FRESH WTR. 1/2 BBL CMT BACK. RD
PRO PETRO.

10:00 - 14:30 4.50 WOIREP 31 I P POOH W/ 62-JTS 2-3/8" J-55 TBG. FILL CSG W/ 3
BBL TMAC. CLEAN LOCATION. SDFN

7/13/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- LOGGING. TRIPPING PIPE. SWABBING.
6:45 - 9:00 2.25 WOIREP 41 C P SICP 0. MIRU PLS. RUN TEMP LOG FROM

SURFACE TO SET DOWN AT 1964'. RD PLS
9:00 - 9:30 0.50 WOIREP 31 I P MU AND RIH W/ NOTCHED XN NIPPLE ON 62-JTS

2-3/8" J-55 TBG. RU TO SWAB
9:30 - 10:30 1.00 WOIREP 42 B P MAKE5 SWAB RUNS. IFL SURFACE. FFL 1200'

PULLED 18.6 BBLS FLUID. 6.9 BBLS FLUID LEFT.
(FLUID LEVEL 1400')

10:30 - 11:30 1.00 WOIREP 31 I P POOH W/ 62-JTS TBG. ND STRIPPING HEAD
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Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date:

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD Start Date: 7/8/2010 End Date: 7/19/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft(above Mean Sea Level) UWl: CIGE 80D

Date Time Duration Phase Code Sub P/U MD From Operation
Start-End (hr) Code (ft)

7/8/2010 9:00 - 11:00 2.00 WOIREP 30 A P ROAD RIG AND EQUIP FROM NBU 921-330 TO
LOCATION. FTP 50, FCP 50. BWD TO PROD TANK.
SPOT AND RUSU. ND WH. NU BOP. RU FLOOR
AND TBG EQUIP. PU ON TBG. TBG STUCK.
WORKING TBG FROM STRING WT TO 50K WHEN
TBG PARTED. ST WT 15K NOW. RU PRS.

11:00 - 16:00 5.00 WOIREP 31 I P SCAN AND SORT AS POOH W/ 131 JTS 2-3/8" J-55
TBG. ALL JTS RED BAND. ID PITTING AND WALL
LOSS. JT #131 HAS PARTED PIN. FISH IS TBG
CPLG WI DUTCHMAN AT 4063'. RD PRS AND
SDFN.

7/9/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- FISHING TBG
6:45 - 9:00 2.25 WOIREP 31 I X SICP 300. BWD. MU 3-3/4" OVERSHOT (3-1/16" GR,

2-3/4" STOP) AND RIH AS MEAS AND PU2-3/8"
J-55 TBG. TAG AND LATCH ONTO FISH AT 4081'
WI 128-JTS IN. WORK TBG 0-50K. NO SUCCESS.

9:00 - 11:30 2.50 WOIREP 34 A X RU CASEDHOLE AND RIH WI 1-11/16" SPUD ASSY.
THRU OVERSHOT AT 4081' DOWN TO SET DOWN
AT 5746'. LOOKS LIKE50-JTS, SN, 1-JT, NC W/
EOT AT 5652'. RIH W/ FREEPOINT TOOLS.
READING AT 4800' SHOWED 50% FREE, 4750'
SHOWED 100% FREE. CONFIRM W/ STATE TO
CUT TBG 4750' (1ST CIBP TO BE SET AT 4743').
RIH W/ 1-11/16" CHEM CUT AND CUT TBG OFF AT
4758'. CUT CLEAN. RD CASEDHOLE.

11:30 - 13:30 2.00 WOIREP 31 I X POOH W/ 128-JTS AND OVERSHOT. RECOVERED
21-JTS AND CUT. (TOTAL OF 152-JTS AND CUT,
TOF AT 4754')

13:30 - 17:30 4.00 WOIREP 34 I P RIH Wl4-1/2" CIBP. SET DOWN ON FISH TOP. PU
4' AND SET AT 4750'. POOH. FILL HOLE W/ 40
BBLS AND P-TEST TO 1000#. GOOD. RIH WI
GR/CBL/CCL AND CORROLATE TO OH. SET
DOWN ON CIBP AT 4740' (EWL) LOG UP TO 4000'
WlO PRESSURE. REPEAT FROM 4740' TO
SURFACE W/ 1000#. GOOD CMT ACROSS BIRDS
NEST AND TOC AT 220'. RD CASEDHOLE. SDFN

7/12/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- TRIPPING TBG. LD TBG.
6:45 - 8:00 1.25 WOIREP 31 I P RIH W/ NOTCHED 1.87" XN AND 149-JTS. EOT AT

4740'.
8:00 - 10:00 2.00 WOIREP 51 D P RU PRO PETRO. PMP 15 SX CMT PLUG #1

4543'-4740'. SPOT BRINE. PULL UP HOLE. PMP 60
SX CMT PLUG #2 2903'-3700' AND SPOT BRINE.
PULL UP HOLE. PMP20 SX CMT PLUG #3
1968'-2194'. PULL UP TO 1968 AND REV HOLE
CLEAN W/ FRESH WTR. 1/2 BBL CMT BACK. RD
PRO PETRO.

10:00 - 14:30 4.50 WOIREP 31 I P POOH W/ 62-JTS 2-3/8" J-55 TBG. FILL CSG W/ 3
BBL TMAC. CLEAN LOCATION. SDFN

7/13/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- LOGGING. TRIPPING PIPE. SWABBING.
6:45 - 9:00 2.25 WOIREP 41 C P SICP 0. MIRU PLS. RUN TEMP LOG FROM

SURFACE TO SET DOWN AT 1964'. RD PLS
9:00 - 9:30 0.50 WOIREP 31 I P MU AND RIH W/ NOTCHED XN NIPPLE ON 62-JTS

2-3/8" J-55 TBG. RU TO SWAB
9:30 - 10:30 1.00 WOIREP 42 B P MAKE5 SWAB RUNS. IFL SURFACE. FFL 1200'

PULLED 18.6 BBLS FLUID. 6.9 BBLS FLUID LEFT.
(FLUID LEVEL 1400')

10:30 - 11:30 1.00 WOIREP 31 I P POOH W/ 62-JTS TBG. ND STRIPPING HEAD
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Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD Start Date: 7/8/2010 End Date: 7/19/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft(above Mean Sea Level) UWl: CIGE 80D

Date Time Duration Phase Code Sub P/U MD From Operation
Start-End (hr) Code (ft)

7/8/2010 9:00 - 11:00 2.00 WOIREP 30 A P ROAD RIG AND EQUIP FROM NBU 921-330 TO
LOCATION. FTP 50, FCP 50. BWD TO PROD TANK.
SPOT AND RUSU. ND WH. NU BOP. RU FLOOR
AND TBG EQUIP. PU ON TBG. TBG STUCK.
WORKING TBG FROM STRING WT TO 50K WHEN
TBG PARTED. ST WT 15K NOW. RU PRS.

11:00 - 16:00 5.00 WOIREP 31 I P SCAN AND SORT AS POOH W/ 131 JTS 2-3/8" J-55
TBG. ALL JTS RED BAND. ID PITTING AND WALL
LOSS. JT #131 HAS PARTED PIN. FISH IS TBG
CPLG WI DUTCHMAN AT 4063'. RD PRS AND
SDFN.

7/9/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- FISHING TBG
6:45 - 9:00 2.25 WOIREP 31 I X SICP 300. BWD. MU 3-3/4" OVERSHOT (3-1/16" GR,

2-3/4" STOP) AND RIH AS MEAS AND PU2-3/8"
J-55 TBG. TAG AND LATCH ONTO FISH AT 4081'
WI 128-JTS IN. WORK TBG 0-50K. NO SUCCESS.

9:00 - 11:30 2.50 WOIREP 34 A X RU CASEDHOLE AND RIH WI 1-11/16" SPUD ASSY.
THRU OVERSHOT AT 4081' DOWN TO SET DOWN
AT 5746'. LOOKS LIKE50-JTS, SN, 1-JT, NC W/
EOT AT 5652'. RIH W/ FREEPOINT TOOLS.
READING AT 4800' SHOWED 50% FREE, 4750'
SHOWED 100% FREE. CONFIRM W/ STATE TO
CUT TBG 4750' (1ST CIBP TO BE SET AT 4743').
RIH W/ 1-11/16" CHEM CUT AND CUT TBG OFF AT
4758'. CUT CLEAN. RD CASEDHOLE.

11:30 - 13:30 2.00 WOIREP 31 I X POOH W/ 128-JTS AND OVERSHOT. RECOVERED
21-JTS AND CUT. (TOTAL OF 152-JTS AND CUT,
TOF AT 4754')

13:30 - 17:30 4.00 WOIREP 34 I P RIH Wl4-1/2" CIBP. SET DOWN ON FISH TOP. PU
4' AND SET AT 4750'. POOH. FILL HOLE W/ 40
BBLS AND P-TEST TO 1000#. GOOD. RIH WI
GR/CBL/CCL AND CORROLATE TO OH. SET
DOWN ON CIBP AT 4740' (EWL) LOG UP TO 4000'
WlO PRESSURE. REPEAT FROM 4740' TO
SURFACE W/ 1000#. GOOD CMT ACROSS BIRDS
NEST AND TOC AT 220'. RD CASEDHOLE. SDFN

7/12/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- TRIPPING TBG. LD TBG.
6:45 - 8:00 1.25 WOIREP 31 I P RIH W/ NOTCHED 1.87" XN AND 149-JTS. EOT AT

4740'.
8:00 - 10:00 2.00 WOIREP 51 D P RU PRO PETRO. PMP 15 SX CMT PLUG #1

4543'-4740'. SPOT BRINE. PULL UP HOLE. PMP 60
SX CMT PLUG #2 2903'-3700' AND SPOT BRINE.
PULL UP HOLE. PMP20 SX CMT PLUG #3
1968'-2194'. PULL UP TO 1968 AND REV HOLE
CLEAN W/ FRESH WTR. 1/2 BBL CMT BACK. RD
PRO PETRO.

10:00 - 14:30 4.50 WOIREP 31 I P POOH W/ 62-JTS 2-3/8" J-55 TBG. FILL CSG W/ 3
BBL TMAC. CLEAN LOCATION. SDFN

7/13/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- LOGGING. TRIPPING PIPE. SWABBING.
6:45 - 9:00 2.25 WOIREP 41 C P SICP 0. MIRU PLS. RUN TEMP LOG FROM

SURFACE TO SET DOWN AT 1964'. RD PLS
9:00 - 9:30 0.50 WOIREP 31 I P MU AND RIH W/ NOTCHED XN NIPPLE ON 62-JTS

2-3/8" J-55 TBG. RU TO SWAB
9:30 - 10:30 1.00 WOIREP 42 B P MAKE5 SWAB RUNS. IFL SURFACE. FFL 1200'

PULLED 18.6 BBLS FLUID. 6.9 BBLS FLUID LEFT.
(FLUID LEVEL 1400')

10:30 - 11:30 1.00 WOIREP 31 I P POOH W/ 62-JTS TBG. ND STRIPPING HEAD
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RECEIVED August 26,



US ROCKIES REGION

Operation Summary Report
Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date: 

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD End Date: 7/19/2010Start Date: 7/8/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft (above Mean Sea Level) UWI: CIGE 80D

     Time     
Start-End

MD From
(ft)

Code Sub 
Code

P/U OperationPhaseDuration
(hr)

Date

WO/REP 37 C P MIRU CUTTERS. RIH W/ 3-1/8" EXP GUN (23 
GRAM, 33" PENT, .35 EHD, 90*, 4 SPF) AND PERF 
BIRDS NEST 1835'-45'. RD CUTTERS.

1.5013:0011:30 -

WO/REP 31 I P RIH W/ NOTCHED 1.87" XN ON 57-JTS 2-3/8" J-55 
TBG. PU 7" 5K HANGER AND LAND 57-JTS W/ EOT 
AT 1807.91'. RD FLOOR. ND BOP. NU WH. RU 
FLOOR TO SWAB.

1.0014:0013:00 -

WO/REP 42 B P MAKE 10 MORE SWAB RUNS. IFL 1300', FFL 1760'. 
PULLED CUMM 23.9 BBL, 1.7 BBL LTR. HAVE NO 
ENTRY.

1.5015:3014:00 -

WO/REP 40 B P FILL HOLE W/ 25 BBL. SPOT ACID TO EOT. BD 
PERFS AT 1200 PSI. INJ 20 BBLS, 3 BPM AT 1500 
PSI. ISIP 500. CUMM TO RECOVER NOW 73 BBL.

0.0015:3015:30 -

WO/REP 42 B P CONT SWABBING. MAKE 10 MORE RUNS. IFL 
SURFACE, FFL 1400'. REC 22 BBLS. CUMM 
TOTALS FOR DAY- RECOVER 45.88, LTR 27.15.

2.0017:3015:30 -

7/14/2010 WO/REP 48 P JSA- SWABBING0.25 6:45 6:30 -
WO/REP 42 B P SICP 0. CONT TO SWAB. MAKE 17-RUNS. IFL 

1300', FFL 1760', RECOVERED 2.67 BBL TODAY, 
GETTING MAYBE 2 GAL BACK ON RUN. CUMM 
TOTAL RECOVERED 49.8 BBL OF 73 BBL. LTR 23.2
BBL. RD SWAB.

5.2512:00 6:45 -

WO/REP 31 I P ND WH. NU BOP. RU FLOOR AND TBG EQUIP. 
PULL AND LD 7" HANGER. POOH W/ 57-JTS TBG. 
PMP 11.5 BBL BACK INTO WELL FOR 
PERFERATING. ND SH. SDFN

2.5014:3012:00 -

7/15/2010 WO/REP 48 P JSA- PERF, RIH, SWAB.0.25 6:45 6:30 -
WO/REP 37 C P SICP 200. BWD. RU CUTTERS. RIH W/ 3-1/8" EXP 

GUN (23 GRAM, .35" EHD, 33" PENT, 3 SPF ON 
120*) AND PERF BIRDS NEST
1860'-75', 15' ZONE, 45 HOLES.
1820'-30', 10' ZONE, 30 HOLES.
1786'-95', 9' ZONE, 27 HOLES.
1755'-75', 20' ZONE, 60 HOLES.
1728'-50', 22' ZONE, 66 HOLES.
RD CUTTERS

2.25 9:00 6:45 -

WO/REP 31 I P MU NOTCHED 1.87" XN AND RIH W/ 57-JTS TBG. 
EOT AT 1807;. RU SWAB.

1.0010:00 9:00 -

WO/REP 42 B P MAKE 23-SWAB RUNS. IFL 850', FFL 1780'. 
RECOVER 16.75 BBL TODAY. CUMM TOTALS 
LOAD 85.5, RCVR 66.5 BBL, LTR 19 BBL. SDFN

5.5015:3010:00 -

7/16/2010 WO/REP 48 P JSA- SWABBING. TRIPPING. RUNNING PKR AND 
PLUG. PUMPING PRESSURES.

0.25 6:45 6:30 -

WO/REP 31 I P SICP 0. MAKE 1 SWAB RUN. FL 1720'. RD SWAB. 
POOH W/ 57-JTS.

0.25 7:00 6:45 -

WO/REP 31 I P PU AND RIN W/ 4-1/2" RBP, RET HEAD, 4' TBG 
SUB, 4-1/2" PKR AND RIH W/ TBG. FILL HOLE W/ 
21.5 BBL.
#1- SET RBP AT 1890' AND PKR AT 1856'. ZONE 
1860'-75'. BD 1200#. PMP 1.5 BPM AT 1350#. 
START TO COMMUNICATE. PMP 5 BBL.
#2- SET RBP AT 1852' AND PKR AT 1812'. ZONE 
1835-45, 1820-30. PUMP INTO AT 900#. PMP 3.25 
BPM AT 1300#. PMP 2.5 BBL THEN START TO 
COMMUNICATE. 
#3- SET RBP AT 1809' AND PKR AT 1780'. ZONE 
1786'-95'. BD 1300#. PMP 1.75  BPM AT 1500#. 
START TO COMMUNICATE. PMP 3.25 BBL. 
#4- SET RBP AT 1781' AND PKR AT 1714'. BD 
1300#. PMP 4 BPM AT 1400#. PMP 4 BBL. PMP 
TOTAL OF 36.25 BBL FLUID. RELEASE TOOLS 
AND POOH. LD PKR AND PLUG.

3.5010:30 7:00 -
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Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date:

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD Start Date: 7/8/2010 End Date: 7/19/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft(above Mean Sea Level) UWl: CIGE 80D

Date Time Duration Phase Code Sub P/U MD From Operation
Start-End (hr) Code (ft)

11:30 - 13:00 1.50 WOIREP 37 C P MIRU CUTTERS. RIH W/ 3-1/8" EXP GUN (23
GRAM, 33" PENT, .35 EHD, 90*, 4 SPF) AND PERF
BIRDS NEST 1835'-45'. RD CUTTERS.

13:00 - 14:00 1.00 WOIREP 31 I P RIH W/ NOTCHED 1.87"XN ON 57-JTS 2-3/8" J-55
TBG. PU 7" 5K HANGER AND LAND 57-JTS W/ EOT
AT 1807.91'. RD FLOOR. ND BOP. NU WH. RU
FLOOR TO SWAB.

14:00 - 15:30 1.50 WOIREP 42 B P MAKE 10 MORE SWAB RUNS. IFL 1300', FFL 1760'.
PULLED CUMM 23.9 BBL, 1.7 BBL LTR. HAVE NO
ENTRY.

15:30 - 15:30 0.00 WOIREP 40 B P FILL HOLE WI25 BBL. SPOT ACID TO EOT. BD
PERFS AT 1200 PSI. INJ 20 BBLS, 3 BPM AT 1500
PSI. ISIP 500. CUMM TO RECOVER NOW 73 BBL.

15:30 - 17:30 2.00 WOIREP 42 B P CONT SWABBING. MAKE 10 MORE RUNS. IFL
SURFACE, FFL 1400'. REC 22 BBLS. CUMM
TOTALS FOR DAY- RECOVER 45.88, LTR 27.15.

7/14/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WO/REP 48 P JSA- SWABBING
6:45 - 12:00 5.25 WOIREP 42 B P SICP 0. CONT TO SWAB. MAKE 17-RUNS. IFL

1300', FFL 1760', RECOVERED 2.67 BBL TODAY,
GETTING MAYBE2 GAL BACK ON RUN. CUMM
TOTAL RECOVERED 49.8 BBL OF 73 BBL. LTR 23.2
BBL. RD SWAB.

12:00 - 14:30 2.50 WOIREP 31 I P ND WH. NU BOP. RU FLOOR AND TBG EQUIP.
PULL AND LD 7" HANGER. POOH WI 57-JTS TBG.
PMP 11.5 BBL BACK INTO WELL FOR
PERFERATING. ND SH. SDFN

7/15/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- PERF, RIH, SWAB.
6:45 - 9:00 2.25 WOIREP 37 C P SICP 200. BWD. RU CUTTERS. RIH WI 3-1/8" EXP

GUN (23 GRAM, .35" EHD, 33" PENT, 3 SPF ON
120*) AND PERF BIRDS NEST
1860'-75', 15' ZONE, 45 HOLES.
1820'-30', 10' ZONE, 30 HOLES.
1786'-95', 9' ZONE, 27 HOLES.
1755'-75', 20' ZONE, 60 HOLES.
1728'-50', 22' ZONE, 66 HOLES.
RD CUTTERS

9:00 - 10:00 1.00 WOIREP 31 I P MU NOTCHED 1.87"XN AND RIH W/ 57-JTS TBG.
EOT AT 1807;. RU SWAB.

10:00 - 15:30 5.50 WOIREP 42 B P MAKE23-SWAB RUNS. IFL 850', FFL 1780'.
RECOVER 16.75 BBL TODAY. CUMM TOTALS
LOAD 85.5, RCVR 66.5 BBL, LTR 19 BBL. SDFN

7/16/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- SWABBING. TRIPPING. RUNNING PKR AND
PLUG. PUMPING PRESSURES.

6:45 - 7:00 0.25 WOIREP 31 I P SICP 0. MAKE 1 SWAB RUN. FL 1720'. RD SWAB.
POOH W/ 57-JTS.

7:00 - 10:30 3.50 WOIREP 31 I P PU AND RIN Wl4-1/2" RBP, RET HEAD, 4' TBG
SUB, 4-1/2" PKR AND RIH WI TBG. FILL HOLE WI
21.5 BBL.
#1- SET RBP AT 1890' AND PKR AT 1856'. ZONE
1860'-75'. BD 1200#. PMP 1.5 BPM AT 1350#.
START TO COMMUNICATE. PMP 5 BBL.
#2- SET RBP AT 1852' AND PKR AT 1812'. ZONE
1835-45, 1820-30. PUMP INTO AT 900#. PMP 3.25
BPM AT 1300#. PMP2.5 BBL THEN START TO
COMMUNICATE.
#3- SET RBP AT 1809' AND PKR AT 1780'. ZONE
1786'-95'. BD 1300#. PMP 1.75 BPM AT 1500#.
START TO COMMUNICATE. PMP 3.25 BBL.
#4- SET RBP AT 1781' AND PKR AT 1714'. BD
1300#. PMP 4 BPM AT 1400#. PMP 4 BBL. PMP
TOTAL OF 36.25 BBL FLUID. RELEASE TOOLS
AND POOH. LD PKR AND PLUG.

8/26/2010 10:56:18AM 2

RECEIVED August 26,

US ROCKIES REGION

Operation Summary Report
Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date:

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD Start Date: 7/8/2010 End Date: 7/19/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft(above Mean Sea Level) UWl: CIGE 80D

Date Time Duration Phase Code Sub P/U MD From Operation
Start-End (hr) Code (ft)

11:30 - 13:00 1.50 WOIREP 37 C P MIRU CUTTERS. RIH W/ 3-1/8" EXP GUN (23
GRAM, 33" PENT, .35 EHD, 90*, 4 SPF) AND PERF
BIRDS NEST 1835'-45'. RD CUTTERS.

13:00 - 14:00 1.00 WOIREP 31 I P RIH W/ NOTCHED 1.87"XN ON 57-JTS 2-3/8" J-55
TBG. PU 7" 5K HANGER AND LAND 57-JTS W/ EOT
AT 1807.91'. RD FLOOR. ND BOP. NU WH. RU
FLOOR TO SWAB.

14:00 - 15:30 1.50 WOIREP 42 B P MAKE 10 MORE SWAB RUNS. IFL 1300', FFL 1760'.
PULLED CUMM 23.9 BBL, 1.7 BBL LTR. HAVE NO
ENTRY.

15:30 - 15:30 0.00 WOIREP 40 B P FILL HOLE WI25 BBL. SPOT ACID TO EOT. BD
PERFS AT 1200 PSI. INJ 20 BBLS, 3 BPM AT 1500
PSI. ISIP 500. CUMM TO RECOVER NOW 73 BBL.

15:30 - 17:30 2.00 WOIREP 42 B P CONT SWABBING. MAKE 10 MORE RUNS. IFL
SURFACE, FFL 1400'. REC 22 BBLS. CUMM
TOTALS FOR DAY- RECOVER 45.88, LTR 27.15.

7/14/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WO/REP 48 P JSA- SWABBING
6:45 - 12:00 5.25 WOIREP 42 B P SICP 0. CONT TO SWAB. MAKE 17-RUNS. IFL

1300', FFL 1760', RECOVERED 2.67 BBL TODAY,
GETTING MAYBE2 GAL BACK ON RUN. CUMM
TOTAL RECOVERED 49.8 BBL OF 73 BBL. LTR 23.2
BBL. RD SWAB.

12:00 - 14:30 2.50 WOIREP 31 I P ND WH. NU BOP. RU FLOOR AND TBG EQUIP.
PULL AND LD 7" HANGER. POOH WI 57-JTS TBG.
PMP 11.5 BBL BACK INTO WELL FOR
PERFERATING. ND SH. SDFN

7/15/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- PERF, RIH, SWAB.
6:45 - 9:00 2.25 WOIREP 37 C P SICP 200. BWD. RU CUTTERS. RIH WI 3-1/8" EXP

GUN (23 GRAM, .35" EHD, 33" PENT, 3 SPF ON
120*) AND PERF BIRDS NEST
1860'-75', 15' ZONE, 45 HOLES.
1820'-30', 10' ZONE, 30 HOLES.
1786'-95', 9' ZONE, 27 HOLES.
1755'-75', 20' ZONE, 60 HOLES.
1728'-50', 22' ZONE, 66 HOLES.
RD CUTTERS

9:00 - 10:00 1.00 WOIREP 31 I P MU NOTCHED 1.87"XN AND RIH W/ 57-JTS TBG.
EOT AT 1807;. RU SWAB.

10:00 - 15:30 5.50 WOIREP 42 B P MAKE23-SWAB RUNS. IFL 850', FFL 1780'.
RECOVER 16.75 BBL TODAY. CUMM TOTALS
LOAD 85.5, RCVR 66.5 BBL, LTR 19 BBL. SDFN

7/16/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- SWABBING. TRIPPING. RUNNING PKR AND
PLUG. PUMPING PRESSURES.

6:45 - 7:00 0.25 WOIREP 31 I P SICP 0. MAKE 1 SWAB RUN. FL 1720'. RD SWAB.
POOH W/ 57-JTS.

7:00 - 10:30 3.50 WOIREP 31 I P PU AND RIN Wl4-1/2" RBP, RET HEAD, 4' TBG
SUB, 4-1/2" PKR AND RIH WI TBG. FILL HOLE WI
21.5 BBL.
#1- SET RBP AT 1890' AND PKR AT 1856'. ZONE
1860'-75'. BD 1200#. PMP 1.5 BPM AT 1350#.
START TO COMMUNICATE. PMP 5 BBL.
#2- SET RBP AT 1852' AND PKR AT 1812'. ZONE
1835-45, 1820-30. PUMP INTO AT 900#. PMP 3.25
BPM AT 1300#. PMP2.5 BBL THEN START TO
COMMUNICATE.
#3- SET RBP AT 1809' AND PKR AT 1780'. ZONE
1786'-95'. BD 1300#. PMP 1.75 BPM AT 1500#.
START TO COMMUNICATE. PMP 3.25 BBL.
#4- SET RBP AT 1781' AND PKR AT 1714'. BD
1300#. PMP 4 BPM AT 1400#. PMP 4 BBL. PMP
TOTAL OF 36.25 BBL FLUID. RELEASE TOOLS
AND POOH. LD PKR AND PLUG.

8/26/2010 10:56:18AM 2

RECEIVED August 26,

US ROCKIES REGION

Operation Summary Report
Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date:

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD Start Date: 7/8/2010 End Date: 7/19/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft(above Mean Sea Level) UWl: CIGE 80D

Date Time Duration Phase Code Sub P/U MD From Operation
Start-End (hr) Code (ft)

11:30 - 13:00 1.50 WOIREP 37 C P MIRU CUTTERS. RIH W/ 3-1/8" EXP GUN (23
GRAM, 33" PENT, .35 EHD, 90*, 4 SPF) AND PERF
BIRDS NEST 1835'-45'. RD CUTTERS.

13:00 - 14:00 1.00 WOIREP 31 I P RIH W/ NOTCHED 1.87"XN ON 57-JTS 2-3/8" J-55
TBG. PU 7" 5K HANGER AND LAND 57-JTS W/ EOT
AT 1807.91'. RD FLOOR. ND BOP. NU WH. RU
FLOOR TO SWAB.

14:00 - 15:30 1.50 WOIREP 42 B P MAKE 10 MORE SWAB RUNS. IFL 1300', FFL 1760'.
PULLED CUMM 23.9 BBL, 1.7 BBL LTR. HAVE NO
ENTRY.

15:30 - 15:30 0.00 WOIREP 40 B P FILL HOLE WI25 BBL. SPOT ACID TO EOT. BD
PERFS AT 1200 PSI. INJ 20 BBLS, 3 BPM AT 1500
PSI. ISIP 500. CUMM TO RECOVER NOW 73 BBL.

15:30 - 17:30 2.00 WOIREP 42 B P CONT SWABBING. MAKE 10 MORE RUNS. IFL
SURFACE, FFL 1400'. REC 22 BBLS. CUMM
TOTALS FOR DAY- RECOVER 45.88, LTR 27.15.

7/14/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WO/REP 48 P JSA- SWABBING
6:45 - 12:00 5.25 WOIREP 42 B P SICP 0. CONT TO SWAB. MAKE 17-RUNS. IFL

1300', FFL 1760', RECOVERED 2.67 BBL TODAY,
GETTING MAYBE2 GAL BACK ON RUN. CUMM
TOTAL RECOVERED 49.8 BBL OF 73 BBL. LTR 23.2
BBL. RD SWAB.

12:00 - 14:30 2.50 WOIREP 31 I P ND WH. NU BOP. RU FLOOR AND TBG EQUIP.
PULL AND LD 7" HANGER. POOH WI 57-JTS TBG.
PMP 11.5 BBL BACK INTO WELL FOR
PERFERATING. ND SH. SDFN

7/15/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- PERF, RIH, SWAB.
6:45 - 9:00 2.25 WOIREP 37 C P SICP 200. BWD. RU CUTTERS. RIH WI 3-1/8" EXP

GUN (23 GRAM, .35" EHD, 33" PENT, 3 SPF ON
120*) AND PERF BIRDS NEST
1860'-75', 15' ZONE, 45 HOLES.
1820'-30', 10' ZONE, 30 HOLES.
1786'-95', 9' ZONE, 27 HOLES.
1755'-75', 20' ZONE, 60 HOLES.
1728'-50', 22' ZONE, 66 HOLES.
RD CUTTERS

9:00 - 10:00 1.00 WOIREP 31 I P MU NOTCHED 1.87"XN AND RIH W/ 57-JTS TBG.
EOT AT 1807;. RU SWAB.

10:00 - 15:30 5.50 WOIREP 42 B P MAKE23-SWAB RUNS. IFL 850', FFL 1780'.
RECOVER 16.75 BBL TODAY. CUMM TOTALS
LOAD 85.5, RCVR 66.5 BBL, LTR 19 BBL. SDFN

7/16/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- SWABBING. TRIPPING. RUNNING PKR AND
PLUG. PUMPING PRESSURES.

6:45 - 7:00 0.25 WOIREP 31 I P SICP 0. MAKE 1 SWAB RUN. FL 1720'. RD SWAB.
POOH W/ 57-JTS.

7:00 - 10:30 3.50 WOIREP 31 I P PU AND RIN Wl4-1/2" RBP, RET HEAD, 4' TBG
SUB, 4-1/2" PKR AND RIH WI TBG. FILL HOLE WI
21.5 BBL.
#1- SET RBP AT 1890' AND PKR AT 1856'. ZONE
1860'-75'. BD 1200#. PMP 1.5 BPM AT 1350#.
START TO COMMUNICATE. PMP 5 BBL.
#2- SET RBP AT 1852' AND PKR AT 1812'. ZONE
1835-45, 1820-30. PUMP INTO AT 900#. PMP 3.25
BPM AT 1300#. PMP2.5 BBL THEN START TO
COMMUNICATE.
#3- SET RBP AT 1809' AND PKR AT 1780'. ZONE
1786'-95'. BD 1300#. PMP 1.75 BPM AT 1500#.
START TO COMMUNICATE. PMP 3.25 BBL.
#4- SET RBP AT 1781' AND PKR AT 1714'. BD
1300#. PMP 4 BPM AT 1400#. PMP 4 BBL. PMP
TOTAL OF 36.25 BBL FLUID. RELEASE TOOLS
AND POOH. LD PKR AND PLUG.

8/26/2010 10:56:18AM 2

RECEIVED August 26,



US ROCKIES REGION

Operation Summary Report
Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date: 

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD End Date: 7/19/2010Start Date: 7/8/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft (above Mean Sea Level) UWI: CIGE 80D

     Time     
Start-End

MD From
(ft)

Code Sub 
Code

P/U OperationPhaseDuration
(hr)

Date

WO/REP 31 I P RIH W/ NOTCHED 1.87" XN AND 57-JTS 2-3/8" J-55 
TBG. PU 7" 5K HANGER. LAND W/ EOT AT 1819'. 
RD FLOOR. ND BOP. NU WH. RU FLOOR AND 
SWAB EQUIP.

2.0012:3010:30 -

WO/REP 42 B P SWAB. MAKE 26 RUNS AFTER BD. IFL SURFACE. 
FFL 1780' (DRY, MAKING 1/2 HR RUNS). RECOVER
27.7 BBL TODAY. LOAD 121.7. RCVR 94.6, LTR 
27.1. RD SWAB. SDFN.

2.0014:3012:30 -

7/17/2010 WO/REP 48 P JSA- SWABBING. RDSU. RUSU. POOH.0.25 6:45 6:30 -
WO/REP 42 B P SICP 300 PSI. BWD. CONT SWAB. MAKE 7 RUNS. 

IFL 1500'. FFL 1720'. SWAB DRY. RECOVER 1.9 
BBL TODAY. CUMM TOTAL= LOAD 121.7, RCVR 
96.5, LTR 25.2. RD SWAB. RDSU. MOVE OFF.

TBG DETAIL      KB                  15.00
7" 5K HANGER                          1.00
57-JTS 2-3/8" J-55 TBG       1801.86
NOTCHED 1.87" XN                    1.05
    EOT                                   1819.91

1.75 8:30 6:45 -

8/12/2010 CIGE 80D
REPORT FOR TODAY, AUG. 12, 2010

BEGINNING CSG PRESS                 150
BEGINNING TBG PRESS                 200
BEGINNING F.L.                                1100

ENDING TBG PRESS                         0
ENDING CSG PRESS                         0
ENDIG F.L.                                           1810       

TOTAL RUNS FOR DAY                    10

TOTAL RECOVERY                             7 BBLS

-

8/13/2010 CIGE 80D
REPORT FOR TODAY, AUG. 13, 2010

BEGINNING CSG PRESS                 100
BEGINNING TBG PRESS                   15

ENDING TBG PRESS                         0
ENDING CSG PRESS                         0
ENDIG F.L.                                           1810       

TOTAL RUNS FOR DAY                    11

TOTAL RECOVERY                             0 BBLS

-

8/16/2010 -

CIGE 80D
REPORT FOR TODAY, AUG. 16, 2010

BEGINNING CSG PRESS                  90
BEGINNING TBG PRESS                   10

ENDING TBG PRESS                         20
ENDING CSG PRESS                          3
ENDIG F.L.                                           1810       

TOTAL RUNS FOR DAY                    2

TOTAL RECOVERY                         2.4 BBLS

-

8/26/2010 10:56:18AM 3

August 26, 2010August 26, 2010

US ROCKIES REGION

Operation Summary Report
Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date:

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD Start Date: 7/8/2010 End Date: 7/19/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft(above Mean Sea Level) UWl: CIGE 80D

Date Time Duration Phase Code Sub P/U MD From Operation
Start-End (hr) Code (ft)

10:30 - 12:30 2.00 WOIREP 31 I P RIH W/ NOTCHED 1.87" XN AND 57-JTS 2-3/8" J-55
TBG. PU 7" 5K HANGER. LANDWI EOT AT 1819'.
RD FLOOR. ND BOP. NU WH. RU FLOOR AND
SWAB EQUIP.

12:30 - 14:30 2.00 WOIREP 42 B P SWAB. MAKE26 RUNS AFTER BD. IFL SURFACE.
FFL 1780' (DRY, MAKING 1/2 HR RUNS). RECOVER
27.7 BBL TODAY. LOAD 121.7. RCVR 94.6, LTR
27.1. RD SWAB. SDFN.

7/17/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- SWABBING. RDSU. RUSU. POOH.
6:45 - 8:30 1.75 WOIREP 42 B P SICP 300 PSI. BWD. CONT SWAB. MAKE7 RUNS.

IFL 1500'. FFL 1720'. SWAB DRY. RECOVER 1.9
BBL TODAY. CUMM TOTAL= LOAD 121.7, RCVR
96.5, LTR 25.2. RD SWAB. RDSU. MOVE OFF.

TBG DETAIL KB 15.00
7" 5K HANGER 1.00
57-JTS 2-3/8" J-55 TBG 1801.86
NOTCHED 1.87" XN 1.05

EOT 1819.91
8/12/2010 - CIGE 80D

REPORT FOR TODAY, AUG. 12, 2010

BEGINNING CSG PRESS 150
BEGINNING TBG PRESS 200
BEGINNING F.L. 1100

ENDING TBG PRESS 0
ENDING CSG PRESS 0
ENDIG F.L. 1810

TOTAL RUNS FOR DAY 10

TOTAL RECOVERY 7 BBLS
8/13/2010 - CIGE 80D

REPORT FOR TODAY, AUG. 13, 2010

BEGINNING CSG PRESS 100
BEGINNING TBG PRESS 15

ENDING TBG PRESS 0
ENDING CSG PRESS 0
ENDIG F.L. 1810

TOTAL RUNS FOR DAY 11

TOTAL RECOVERY 0 BBLS
8/16/2010

CIGE 80D
REPORT FOR TODAY, AUG. 16, 2010

BEGINNING CSG PRESS 90
BEGINNING TBG PRESS 10

ENDING TBG PRESS 20
ENDING CSG PRESS 3
ENDIG F.L. 1810

TOTAL RUNS FOR DAY 2

TOTAL RECOVERY 2.4 BBLS

8/26/2010 10:56:18AM 3

RECEIVED August 26,

US ROCKIES REGION

Operation Summary Report
Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date:

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD Start Date: 7/8/2010 End Date: 7/19/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft(above Mean Sea Level) UWl: CIGE 80D

Date Time Duration Phase Code Sub P/U MD From Operation
Start-End (hr) Code (ft)

10:30 - 12:30 2.00 WOIREP 31 I P RIH W/ NOTCHED 1.87" XN AND 57-JTS 2-3/8" J-55
TBG. PU 7" 5K HANGER. LANDWI EOT AT 1819'.
RD FLOOR. ND BOP. NU WH. RU FLOOR AND
SWAB EQUIP.

12:30 - 14:30 2.00 WOIREP 42 B P SWAB. MAKE26 RUNS AFTER BD. IFL SURFACE.
FFL 1780' (DRY, MAKING 1/2 HR RUNS). RECOVER
27.7 BBL TODAY. LOAD 121.7. RCVR 94.6, LTR
27.1. RD SWAB. SDFN.

7/17/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- SWABBING. RDSU. RUSU. POOH.
6:45 - 8:30 1.75 WOIREP 42 B P SICP 300 PSI. BWD. CONT SWAB. MAKE7 RUNS.

IFL 1500'. FFL 1720'. SWAB DRY. RECOVER 1.9
BBL TODAY. CUMM TOTAL= LOAD 121.7, RCVR
96.5, LTR 25.2. RD SWAB. RDSU. MOVE OFF.

TBG DETAIL KB 15.00
7" 5K HANGER 1.00
57-JTS 2-3/8" J-55 TBG 1801.86
NOTCHED 1.87" XN 1.05

EOT 1819.91
8/12/2010 - CIGE 80D

REPORT FOR TODAY, AUG. 12, 2010

BEGINNING CSG PRESS 150
BEGINNING TBG PRESS 200
BEGINNING F.L. 1100

ENDING TBG PRESS 0
ENDING CSG PRESS 0
ENDIG F.L. 1810

TOTAL RUNS FOR DAY 10

TOTAL RECOVERY 7 BBLS
8/13/2010 - CIGE 80D

REPORT FOR TODAY, AUG. 13, 2010

BEGINNING CSG PRESS 100
BEGINNING TBG PRESS 15

ENDING TBG PRESS 0
ENDING CSG PRESS 0
ENDIG F.L. 1810

TOTAL RUNS FOR DAY 11

TOTAL RECOVERY 0 BBLS
8/16/2010

CIGE 80D
REPORT FOR TODAY, AUG. 16, 2010

BEGINNING CSG PRESS 90
BEGINNING TBG PRESS 10

ENDING TBG PRESS 20
ENDING CSG PRESS 3
ENDIG F.L. 1810

TOTAL RUNS FOR DAY 2

TOTAL RECOVERY 2.4 BBLS

8/26/2010 10:56:18AM 3

RECEIVED August 26,

US ROCKIES REGION

Operation Summary Report
Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date:

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD Start Date: 7/8/2010 End Date: 7/19/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft(above Mean Sea Level) UWl: CIGE 80D

Date Time Duration Phase Code Sub P/U MD From Operation
Start-End (hr) Code (ft)

10:30 - 12:30 2.00 WOIREP 31 I P RIH W/ NOTCHED 1.87" XN AND 57-JTS 2-3/8" J-55
TBG. PU 7" 5K HANGER. LANDWI EOT AT 1819'.
RD FLOOR. ND BOP. NU WH. RU FLOOR AND
SWAB EQUIP.

12:30 - 14:30 2.00 WOIREP 42 B P SWAB. MAKE26 RUNS AFTER BD. IFL SURFACE.
FFL 1780' (DRY, MAKING 1/2 HR RUNS). RECOVER
27.7 BBL TODAY. LOAD 121.7. RCVR 94.6, LTR
27.1. RD SWAB. SDFN.

7/17/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- SWABBING. RDSU. RUSU. POOH.
6:45 - 8:30 1.75 WOIREP 42 B P SICP 300 PSI. BWD. CONT SWAB. MAKE7 RUNS.

IFL 1500'. FFL 1720'. SWAB DRY. RECOVER 1.9
BBL TODAY. CUMM TOTAL= LOAD 121.7, RCVR
96.5, LTR 25.2. RD SWAB. RDSU. MOVE OFF.

TBG DETAIL KB 15.00
7" 5K HANGER 1.00
57-JTS 2-3/8" J-55 TBG 1801.86
NOTCHED 1.87" XN 1.05

EOT 1819.91
8/12/2010 - CIGE 80D

REPORT FOR TODAY, AUG. 12, 2010

BEGINNING CSG PRESS 150
BEGINNING TBG PRESS 200
BEGINNING F.L. 1100

ENDING TBG PRESS 0
ENDING CSG PRESS 0
ENDIG F.L. 1810

TOTAL RUNS FOR DAY 10

TOTAL RECOVERY 7 BBLS
8/13/2010 - CIGE 80D

REPORT FOR TODAY, AUG. 13, 2010

BEGINNING CSG PRESS 100
BEGINNING TBG PRESS 15

ENDING TBG PRESS 0
ENDING CSG PRESS 0
ENDIG F.L. 1810

TOTAL RUNS FOR DAY 11

TOTAL RECOVERY 0 BBLS
8/16/2010

CIGE 80D
REPORT FOR TODAY, AUG. 16, 2010

BEGINNING CSG PRESS 90
BEGINNING TBG PRESS 10

ENDING TBG PRESS 20
ENDING CSG PRESS 3
ENDIG F.L. 1810

TOTAL RUNS FOR DAY 2

TOTAL RECOVERY 2.4 BBLS
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API Well No: 43047308530000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML-22652 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CIGE 80D 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047308530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6007  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0870 FNL 1018 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

12/7/2010

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: SWD Monitor Well

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The operator requests approval to add additional perforations to the Bird's
Nest formation in this SWD monitor well. Possible breakdown and more
swabbing and sampling would follow. Please see the attached wellbore

diagram for proposed and existing perforations. Thank you.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Andy Lytle 720 929-6100

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 12/6/2010

December 06, 2010

12/06/2010

iPI Well No: 43047308530000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING LEA252E65D2ESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. NATURAL BUTTES

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well CIGE 80D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P. 43047308530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6007 Ext NATURAL BUTTES

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0870 FNL 1018 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.05 Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

12/7/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: SWD Monitor Well

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The operator requests approval to add additional perforations to the Bird's
Nest formation in this SWD monitor well. Possible breakdown and more Accepted by the
swabbing and sampling would follow. Please see the attached wellbore Utah Division of

diagram for proposed and existing perforations. Thank you. Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: 12/06/2 0

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
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SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 12/6/2010
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CNTY: FT.: 870' FNL 1018' FWL
STATE: Q-Q: NWNW

SEC.: 2
TWS: 10S
RGE: 21E

KB (ft): 5093            
GL (ft): 5080 CASING RECORD

TD (ft): 6008 HOLE (in) SIZE (in) WT (lb/ft) GRADE TOP (ft) BTM (ft)
PBTD (ft): 1964 12.25" 9 5/8" 36 K-55 0 200

7.875" 4 1/2 11.6 N-80 0 6008

9 5/8" 24# K-55 @ 200'  

TOC @ 220'

TUBING RECORD

SIZE (in) WT (lb/ft) GRADE TOP (ft) BTM (ft)
2.375" 4.7 J-55 0 1819 Has XN Nipple

  

PERFORATION RECORD
ZONE TOP (ft) BTM (ft) SPF DATE SHOT STATUS

Bird's Nest 1728 1750 3 07/15/10 Open
Bird's Nest 1755 1775 3 07/15/10 Open
Bird's Nest 1786 1795 3 07/15/10 Open
Bird's Nest 1820 1830 3 07/15/10 Open
Bird's Nest 1835 1845 4 07/13/10 Open
Bird's Nest 1860 1875 3 07/15/10 Open

Proposed New Perfs
Bird's Nest 1,630 1635 4
Bird's Nest 1,647 1651 4
Bird's Nest 1674 1690 4
Bird's Nest 1717 1723 4

Top of Green River,
@ ~1417'

Bird' Nest @ 1584'
Birds Nest perforations

PBTD @ 1964'

 
4 1/2" 11.6#, N-80'
TD @ 6008'

   

WELL: Cige 80D UINTAH
FIELD: NATURAL BUTTES UTAH

API #
LEASE #: ML-22652

EPA PERMIT #:

CURRENT WELLBORE DIAGRAM (7/16/2010)

December 06, 2010December 06, 2010
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API Well No: 43047308530000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML-22652 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CIGE 80D 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047308530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6007  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0870 FNL 1018 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

12/30/2010

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: SWD MONITOR WELL

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The operator has concluded additional work on this SWD Monitor well. The
operator has added additional perforations to the Bird's Nest formation and
has treated those new perforations and collected samples. Please see the

attached chronological well history for details of the operation.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Andy Lytle 720 929-6100

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 1/5/2011

January 05, 2011

01/05/2011

iPI Well No: 43047308530000
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has treated those new perforations and collected samples. Please see the Utah Division of
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FOR REGORO(OINLY
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Andy Lytle 720 929-6100 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 1/5/2011
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US ROCKIES REGION

Operation Summary Report
Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date: 

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD End Date: 7/19/2010Start Date: 7/8/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft (above Mean Sea Level) UWI: CIGE 80D

     Time     
Start-End

MD From
(ft)

Code Sub 
Code

P/U OperationPhaseDuration
(hr)

Date

7/8/2010 WO/REP 30 A P ROAD RIG AND EQUIP FROM NBU 921-33O TO 
LOCATION. FTP 50, FCP 50. BWD TO PROD TANK. 
SPOT AND RUSU. ND WH. NU BOP. RU FLOOR 
AND TBG EQUIP. PU ON TBG. TBG STUCK. 
WORKING TBG FROM STRING WT TO 50K WHEN 
TBG PARTED. ST WT 15K NOW. RU PRS.

2.0011:00 9:00 -

WO/REP 31 I P SCAN AND SORT AS POOH W/ 131 JTS 2-3/8" J-55 
TBG. ALL JTS RED BAND. ID PITTING AND WALL 
LOSS. JT #131 HAS PARTED PIN. FISH IS TBG 
CPLG W/ DUTCHMAN AT 4063'. RD PRS AND 
SDFN.

5.0016:0011:00 -

7/9/2010 WO/REP 48 P JSA- FISHING TBG0.25 6:45 6:30 -
WO/REP 31 I X SICP 300. BWD. MU 3-3/4" OVERSHOT (3-1/16" GR, 

2-3/4" STOP) AND RIH AS MEAS AND PU 2-3/8" 
J-55 TBG. TAG AND LATCH ONTO FISH AT 4081' 
W/ 128-JTS IN. WORK TBG 0-50K. NO SUCCESS.

2.25 9:00 6:45 -

WO/REP 34 A X RU CASEDHOLE AND RIH W/ 1-11/16" SPUD ASSY.
THRU OVERSHOT AT 4081' DOWN TO SET DOWN 
AT 5746'. LOOKS LIKE 50-JTS, SN, 1-JT, NC W/ 
EOT AT 5652'. RIH W/ FREEPOINT TOOLS. 
READING AT 4800' SHOWED 50% FREE, 4750' 
SHOWED 100% FREE. CONFIRM W/ STATE TO 
CUT TBG 4750' (1ST CIBP TO BE SET AT 4743'). 
RIH W/ 1-11/16" CHEM CUT AND CUT TBG OFF AT 
4758'. CUT CLEAN. RD CASEDHOLE.

2.5011:30 9:00 -

WO/REP 31 I X POOH W/ 128-JTS AND OVERSHOT. RECOVERED 
21-JTS AND CUT. (TOTAL OF 152-JTS AND CUT, 
TOF AT 4754')

2.0013:3011:30 -

WO/REP 34 I P RIH W/ 4-1/2" CIBP. SET DOWN ON FISH TOP. PU 
4' AND SET AT 4750'. POOH. FILL HOLE W/ 40 
BBLS AND P-TEST TO 1000#. GOOD. RIH W/ 
GR/CBL/CCL AND CORROLATE TO OH. SET 
DOWN ON CIBP AT 4740' (EWL) LOG UP TO 4000' 
W/O PRESSURE. REPEAT FROM 4740' TO 
SURFACE W/ 1000#. GOOD CMT ACROSS BIRDS 
NEST AND TOC AT 220'. RD CASEDHOLE. SDFN

4.0017:3013:30 -

7/12/2010 WO/REP 48 P JSA- TRIPPING TBG. LD TBG.0.25 6:45 6:30 -
WO/REP 31 I P RIH W/ NOTCHED 1.87" XN AND 149-JTS. EOT AT 

4740'.
1.25 8:00 6:45 -

WO/REP 51 D P RU PRO PETRO. PMP 15 SX CMT PLUG #1 
4543'-4740'. SPOT BRINE. PULL UP HOLE. PMP 60 
SX CMT PLUG #2 2903'-3700' AND SPOT BRINE. 
PULL UP HOLE. PMP 20 SX CMT PLUG #3 
1968'-2194'. PULL UP TO 1968 AND REV HOLE 
CLEAN W/ FRESH WTR. 1/2 BBL CMT BACK. RD 
PRO PETRO.

2.0010:00 8:00 -

WO/REP 31 I P POOH W/ 62-JTS 2-3/8" J-55 TBG. FILL CSG W/ 3 
BBL TMAC. CLEAN LOCATION. SDFN

4.5014:3010:00 -

7/13/2010 WO/REP 48 P JSA- LOGGING. TRIPPING PIPE. SWABBING.0.25 6:45 6:30 -
WO/REP 41 C P SICP 0. MIRU PLS. RUN TEMP LOG FROM 

SURFACE TO SET DOWN AT 1964'. RD PLS
2.25 9:00 6:45 -

WO/REP 31 I P MU AND RIH W/ NOTCHED XN NIPPLE ON 62-JTS 
2-3/8" J-55 TBG. RU TO SWAB

0.50 9:30 9:00 -

WO/REP 42 B P MAKE 5 SWAB RUNS. IFL SURFACE. FFL 1200' 
PULLED 18.6 BBLS FLUID. 6.9 BBLS FLUID LEFT. 
(FLUID LEVEL 1400')

1.0010:30 9:30 -

WO/REP 31 I P POOH W/ 62-JTS TBG. ND STRIPPING HEAD1.0011:3010:30 -

1/5/2011 11:25:16AM 1

January 05, 2011January 05, 2011

US ROCKIES REGION

Operation Summary Report
Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date:

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD Start Date: 7/8/2010 End Date: 7/19/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft(above Mean Sea Level) UWl: CIGE 80D

Date Time Duration Phase Code Sub P/U MD From Operation
Start-End (hr) Code (ft)

7/8/2010 9:00 - 11:00 2.00 WOIREP 30 A P ROAD RIG AND EQUIP FROM NBU 921-330 TO
LOCATION. FTP 50, FCP 50. BWD TO PROD TANK.
SPOT AND RUSU. ND WH. NU BOP. RU FLOOR
AND TBG EQUIP. PU ON TBG. TBG STUCK.
WORKING TBG FROM STRING WT TO 50K WHEN
TBG PARTED. ST WT 15K NOW. RU PRS.

11:00 - 16:00 5.00 WOIREP 31 I P SCAN AND SORT AS POOH W/ 131 JTS 2-3/8" J-55
TBG. ALL JTS RED BAND. ID PITTING AND WALL
LOSS. JT #131 HAS PARTED PIN. FISH IS TBG
CPLG WI DUTCHMAN AT 4063'. RD PRS AND
SDFN.

7/9/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- FISHING TBG
6:45 - 9:00 2.25 WOIREP 31 I X SICP 300. BWD. MU 3-3/4" OVERSHOT (3-1/16" GR,

2-3/4" STOP) AND RIH AS MEAS AND PU2-3/8"
J-55 TBG. TAG AND LATCH ONTO FISH AT 4081'
WI 128-JTS IN. WORK TBG 0-50K. NO SUCCESS.

9:00 - 11:30 2.50 WOIREP 34 A X RU CASEDHOLE AND RIH WI 1-11/16" SPUD ASSY.
THRU OVERSHOT AT 4081' DOWN TO SET DOWN
AT 5746'. LOOKS LIKE50-JTS, SN, 1-JT, NC W/
EOT AT 5652'. RIH W/ FREEPOINT TOOLS.
READING AT 4800' SHOWED 50% FREE, 4750'
SHOWED 100% FREE. CONFIRM W/ STATE TO
CUT TBG 4750' (1ST CIBP TO BE SET AT 4743').
RIH W/ 1-11/16" CHEM CUT AND CUT TBG OFF AT
4758'. CUT CLEAN. RD CASEDHOLE.

11:30 - 13:30 2.00 WOIREP 31 I X POOH W/ 128-JTS AND OVERSHOT. RECOVERED
21-JTS AND CUT. (TOTAL OF 152-JTS AND CUT,
TOF AT 4754')

13:30 - 17:30 4.00 WOIREP 34 I P RIH Wl4-1/2" CIBP. SET DOWN ON FISH TOP. PU
4' AND SET AT 4750'. POOH. FILL HOLE W/ 40
BBLS AND P-TEST TO 1000#. GOOD. RIH WI
GR/CBL/CCL AND CORROLATE TO OH. SET
DOWN ON CIBP AT 4740' (EWL) LOG UP TO 4000'
WlO PRESSURE. REPEAT FROM 4740' TO
SURFACE W/ 1000#. GOOD CMT ACROSS BIRDS
NEST AND TOC AT 220'. RD CASEDHOLE. SDFN

7/12/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- TRIPPING TBG. LD TBG.
6:45 - 8:00 1.25 WOIREP 31 I P RIH W/ NOTCHED 1.87" XN AND 149-JTS. EOT AT

4740'.
8:00 - 10:00 2.00 WOIREP 51 D P RU PRO PETRO. PMP 15 SX CMT PLUG #1

4543'-4740'. SPOT BRINE. PULL UP HOLE. PMP 60
SX CMT PLUG #2 2903'-3700' AND SPOT BRINE.
PULL UP HOLE. PMP20 SX CMT PLUG #3
1968'-2194'. PULL UP TO 1968 AND REV HOLE
CLEAN W/ FRESH WTR. 1/2 BBL CMT BACK. RD
PRO PETRO.

10:00 - 14:30 4.50 WOIREP 31 I P POOH W/ 62-JTS 2-3/8" J-55 TBG. FILL CSG W/ 3
BBL TMAC. CLEAN LOCATION. SDFN

7/13/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- LOGGING. TRIPPING PIPE. SWABBING.
6:45 - 9:00 2.25 WOIREP 41 C P SICP 0. MIRU PLS. RUN TEMP LOG FROM

SURFACE TO SET DOWN AT 1964'. RD PLS
9:00 - 9:30 0.50 WOIREP 31 I P MU AND RIH W/ NOTCHED XN NIPPLE ON 62-JTS

2-3/8" J-55 TBG. RU TO SWAB
9:30 - 10:30 1.00 WOIREP 42 B P MAKE5 SWAB RUNS. IFL SURFACE. FFL 1200'

PULLED 18.6 BBLS FLUID. 6.9 BBLS FLUID LEFT.
(FLUID LEVEL 1400')

10:30 - 11:30 1.00 WOIREP 31 I P POOH W/ 62-JTS TBG. ND STRIPPING HEAD

1/5/2011 11:25:16AM 1
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Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date:

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD Start Date: 7/8/2010 End Date: 7/19/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft(above Mean Sea Level) UWl: CIGE 80D

Date Time Duration Phase Code Sub P/U MD From Operation
Start-End (hr) Code (ft)

7/8/2010 9:00 - 11:00 2.00 WOIREP 30 A P ROAD RIG AND EQUIP FROM NBU 921-330 TO
LOCATION. FTP 50, FCP 50. BWD TO PROD TANK.
SPOT AND RUSU. ND WH. NU BOP. RU FLOOR
AND TBG EQUIP. PU ON TBG. TBG STUCK.
WORKING TBG FROM STRING WT TO 50K WHEN
TBG PARTED. ST WT 15K NOW. RU PRS.

11:00 - 16:00 5.00 WOIREP 31 I P SCAN AND SORT AS POOH W/ 131 JTS 2-3/8" J-55
TBG. ALL JTS RED BAND. ID PITTING AND WALL
LOSS. JT #131 HAS PARTED PIN. FISH IS TBG
CPLG WI DUTCHMAN AT 4063'. RD PRS AND
SDFN.

7/9/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- FISHING TBG
6:45 - 9:00 2.25 WOIREP 31 I X SICP 300. BWD. MU 3-3/4" OVERSHOT (3-1/16" GR,

2-3/4" STOP) AND RIH AS MEAS AND PU2-3/8"
J-55 TBG. TAG AND LATCH ONTO FISH AT 4081'
WI 128-JTS IN. WORK TBG 0-50K. NO SUCCESS.

9:00 - 11:30 2.50 WOIREP 34 A X RU CASEDHOLE AND RIH WI 1-11/16" SPUD ASSY.
THRU OVERSHOT AT 4081' DOWN TO SET DOWN
AT 5746'. LOOKS LIKE50-JTS, SN, 1-JT, NC W/
EOT AT 5652'. RIH W/ FREEPOINT TOOLS.
READING AT 4800' SHOWED 50% FREE, 4750'
SHOWED 100% FREE. CONFIRM W/ STATE TO
CUT TBG 4750' (1ST CIBP TO BE SET AT 4743').
RIH W/ 1-11/16" CHEM CUT AND CUT TBG OFF AT
4758'. CUT CLEAN. RD CASEDHOLE.

11:30 - 13:30 2.00 WOIREP 31 I X POOH W/ 128-JTS AND OVERSHOT. RECOVERED
21-JTS AND CUT. (TOTAL OF 152-JTS AND CUT,
TOF AT 4754')

13:30 - 17:30 4.00 WOIREP 34 I P RIH Wl4-1/2" CIBP. SET DOWN ON FISH TOP. PU
4' AND SET AT 4750'. POOH. FILL HOLE W/ 40
BBLS AND P-TEST TO 1000#. GOOD. RIH WI
GR/CBL/CCL AND CORROLATE TO OH. SET
DOWN ON CIBP AT 4740' (EWL) LOG UP TO 4000'
WlO PRESSURE. REPEAT FROM 4740' TO
SURFACE W/ 1000#. GOOD CMT ACROSS BIRDS
NEST AND TOC AT 220'. RD CASEDHOLE. SDFN

7/12/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- TRIPPING TBG. LD TBG.
6:45 - 8:00 1.25 WOIREP 31 I P RIH W/ NOTCHED 1.87" XN AND 149-JTS. EOT AT

4740'.
8:00 - 10:00 2.00 WOIREP 51 D P RU PRO PETRO. PMP 15 SX CMT PLUG #1

4543'-4740'. SPOT BRINE. PULL UP HOLE. PMP 60
SX CMT PLUG #2 2903'-3700' AND SPOT BRINE.
PULL UP HOLE. PMP20 SX CMT PLUG #3
1968'-2194'. PULL UP TO 1968 AND REV HOLE
CLEAN W/ FRESH WTR. 1/2 BBL CMT BACK. RD
PRO PETRO.

10:00 - 14:30 4.50 WOIREP 31 I P POOH W/ 62-JTS 2-3/8" J-55 TBG. FILL CSG W/ 3
BBL TMAC. CLEAN LOCATION. SDFN

7/13/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- LOGGING. TRIPPING PIPE. SWABBING.
6:45 - 9:00 2.25 WOIREP 41 C P SICP 0. MIRU PLS. RUN TEMP LOG FROM

SURFACE TO SET DOWN AT 1964'. RD PLS
9:00 - 9:30 0.50 WOIREP 31 I P MU AND RIH W/ NOTCHED XN NIPPLE ON 62-JTS

2-3/8" J-55 TBG. RU TO SWAB
9:30 - 10:30 1.00 WOIREP 42 B P MAKE5 SWAB RUNS. IFL SURFACE. FFL 1200'

PULLED 18.6 BBLS FLUID. 6.9 BBLS FLUID LEFT.
(FLUID LEVEL 1400')

10:30 - 11:30 1.00 WOIREP 31 I P POOH W/ 62-JTS TBG. ND STRIPPING HEAD
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Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD Start Date: 7/8/2010 End Date: 7/19/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft(above Mean Sea Level) UWl: CIGE 80D

Date Time Duration Phase Code Sub P/U MD From Operation
Start-End (hr) Code (ft)

7/8/2010 9:00 - 11:00 2.00 WOIREP 30 A P ROAD RIG AND EQUIP FROM NBU 921-330 TO
LOCATION. FTP 50, FCP 50. BWD TO PROD TANK.
SPOT AND RUSU. ND WH. NU BOP. RU FLOOR
AND TBG EQUIP. PU ON TBG. TBG STUCK.
WORKING TBG FROM STRING WT TO 50K WHEN
TBG PARTED. ST WT 15K NOW. RU PRS.

11:00 - 16:00 5.00 WOIREP 31 I P SCAN AND SORT AS POOH W/ 131 JTS 2-3/8" J-55
TBG. ALL JTS RED BAND. ID PITTING AND WALL
LOSS. JT #131 HAS PARTED PIN. FISH IS TBG
CPLG WI DUTCHMAN AT 4063'. RD PRS AND
SDFN.

7/9/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- FISHING TBG
6:45 - 9:00 2.25 WOIREP 31 I X SICP 300. BWD. MU 3-3/4" OVERSHOT (3-1/16" GR,

2-3/4" STOP) AND RIH AS MEAS AND PU2-3/8"
J-55 TBG. TAG AND LATCH ONTO FISH AT 4081'
WI 128-JTS IN. WORK TBG 0-50K. NO SUCCESS.

9:00 - 11:30 2.50 WOIREP 34 A X RU CASEDHOLE AND RIH WI 1-11/16" SPUD ASSY.
THRU OVERSHOT AT 4081' DOWN TO SET DOWN
AT 5746'. LOOKS LIKE50-JTS, SN, 1-JT, NC W/
EOT AT 5652'. RIH W/ FREEPOINT TOOLS.
READING AT 4800' SHOWED 50% FREE, 4750'
SHOWED 100% FREE. CONFIRM W/ STATE TO
CUT TBG 4750' (1ST CIBP TO BE SET AT 4743').
RIH W/ 1-11/16" CHEM CUT AND CUT TBG OFF AT
4758'. CUT CLEAN. RD CASEDHOLE.

11:30 - 13:30 2.00 WOIREP 31 I X POOH W/ 128-JTS AND OVERSHOT. RECOVERED
21-JTS AND CUT. (TOTAL OF 152-JTS AND CUT,
TOF AT 4754')

13:30 - 17:30 4.00 WOIREP 34 I P RIH Wl4-1/2" CIBP. SET DOWN ON FISH TOP. PU
4' AND SET AT 4750'. POOH. FILL HOLE W/ 40
BBLS AND P-TEST TO 1000#. GOOD. RIH WI
GR/CBL/CCL AND CORROLATE TO OH. SET
DOWN ON CIBP AT 4740' (EWL) LOG UP TO 4000'
WlO PRESSURE. REPEAT FROM 4740' TO
SURFACE W/ 1000#. GOOD CMT ACROSS BIRDS
NEST AND TOC AT 220'. RD CASEDHOLE. SDFN

7/12/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- TRIPPING TBG. LD TBG.
6:45 - 8:00 1.25 WOIREP 31 I P RIH W/ NOTCHED 1.87" XN AND 149-JTS. EOT AT

4740'.
8:00 - 10:00 2.00 WOIREP 51 D P RU PRO PETRO. PMP 15 SX CMT PLUG #1

4543'-4740'. SPOT BRINE. PULL UP HOLE. PMP 60
SX CMT PLUG #2 2903'-3700' AND SPOT BRINE.
PULL UP HOLE. PMP20 SX CMT PLUG #3
1968'-2194'. PULL UP TO 1968 AND REV HOLE
CLEAN W/ FRESH WTR. 1/2 BBL CMT BACK. RD
PRO PETRO.

10:00 - 14:30 4.50 WOIREP 31 I P POOH W/ 62-JTS 2-3/8" J-55 TBG. FILL CSG W/ 3
BBL TMAC. CLEAN LOCATION. SDFN

7/13/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- LOGGING. TRIPPING PIPE. SWABBING.
6:45 - 9:00 2.25 WOIREP 41 C P SICP 0. MIRU PLS. RUN TEMP LOG FROM

SURFACE TO SET DOWN AT 1964'. RD PLS
9:00 - 9:30 0.50 WOIREP 31 I P MU AND RIH W/ NOTCHED XN NIPPLE ON 62-JTS

2-3/8" J-55 TBG. RU TO SWAB
9:30 - 10:30 1.00 WOIREP 42 B P MAKE5 SWAB RUNS. IFL SURFACE. FFL 1200'

PULLED 18.6 BBLS FLUID. 6.9 BBLS FLUID LEFT.
(FLUID LEVEL 1400')

10:30 - 11:30 1.00 WOIREP 31 I P POOH W/ 62-JTS TBG. ND STRIPPING HEAD
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US ROCKIES REGION

Operation Summary Report
Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date: 

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD End Date: 7/19/2010Start Date: 7/8/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft (above Mean Sea Level) UWI: CIGE 80D

     Time     
Start-End

MD From
(ft)

Code Sub 
Code

P/U OperationPhaseDuration
(hr)

Date

WO/REP 37 C P MIRU CUTTERS. RIH W/ 3-1/8" EXP GUN (23 
GRAM, 33" PENT, .35 EHD, 90*, 4 SPF) AND PERF 
BIRDS NEST 1835'-45'. RD CUTTERS.

1.5013:0011:30 -

WO/REP 31 I P RIH W/ NOTCHED 1.87" XN ON 57-JTS 2-3/8" J-55 
TBG. PU 7" 5K HANGER AND LAND 57-JTS W/ EOT 
AT 1807.91'. RD FLOOR. ND BOP. NU WH. RU 
FLOOR TO SWAB.

1.0014:0013:00 -

WO/REP 42 B P MAKE 10 MORE SWAB RUNS. IFL 1300', FFL 1760'. 
PULLED CUMM 23.9 BBL, 1.7 BBL LTR. HAVE NO 
ENTRY.

1.5015:3014:00 -

WO/REP 40 B P FILL HOLE W/ 25 BBL. SPOT ACID TO EOT. BD 
PERFS AT 1200 PSI. INJ 20 BBLS, 3 BPM AT 1500 
PSI. ISIP 500. CUMM TO RECOVER NOW 73 BBL.

0.0015:3015:30 -

WO/REP 42 B P CONT SWABBING. MAKE 10 MORE RUNS. IFL 
SURFACE, FFL 1400'. REC 22 BBLS. CUMM 
TOTALS FOR DAY- RECOVER 45.88, LTR 27.15.

2.0017:3015:30 -

7/14/2010 WO/REP 48 P JSA- SWABBING0.25 6:45 6:30 -
WO/REP 42 B P SICP 0. CONT TO SWAB. MAKE 17-RUNS. IFL 

1300', FFL 1760', RECOVERED 2.67 BBL TODAY, 
GETTING MAYBE 2 GAL BACK ON RUN. CUMM 
TOTAL RECOVERED 49.8 BBL OF 73 BBL. LTR 23.2
BBL. RD SWAB.

5.2512:00 6:45 -

WO/REP 31 I P ND WH. NU BOP. RU FLOOR AND TBG EQUIP. 
PULL AND LD 7" HANGER. POOH W/ 57-JTS TBG. 
PMP 11.5 BBL BACK INTO WELL FOR 
PERFERATING. ND SH. SDFN

2.5014:3012:00 -

7/15/2010 WO/REP 48 P JSA- PERF, RIH, SWAB.0.25 6:45 6:30 -
WO/REP 37 C P SICP 200. BWD. RU CUTTERS. RIH W/ 3-1/8" EXP 

GUN (23 GRAM, .35" EHD, 33" PENT, 3 SPF ON 
120*) AND PERF BIRDS NEST
1860'-75', 15' ZONE, 45 HOLES.
1820'-30', 10' ZONE, 30 HOLES.
1786'-95', 9' ZONE, 27 HOLES.
1755'-75', 20' ZONE, 60 HOLES.
1728'-50', 22' ZONE, 66 HOLES.
RD CUTTERS

2.25 9:00 6:45 -

WO/REP 31 I P MU NOTCHED 1.87" XN AND RIH W/ 57-JTS TBG. 
EOT AT 1807;. RU SWAB.

1.0010:00 9:00 -

WO/REP 42 B P MAKE 23-SWAB RUNS. IFL 850', FFL 1780'. 
RECOVER 16.75 BBL TODAY. CUMM TOTALS 
LOAD 85.5, RCVR 66.5 BBL, LTR 19 BBL. SDFN

5.5015:3010:00 -

7/16/2010 WO/REP 48 P JSA- SWABBING. TRIPPING. RUNNING PKR AND 
PLUG. PUMPING PRESSURES.

0.25 6:45 6:30 -

WO/REP 31 I P SICP 0. MAKE 1 SWAB RUN. FL 1720'. RD SWAB. 
POOH W/ 57-JTS.

0.25 7:00 6:45 -

WO/REP 31 I P PU AND RIN W/ 4-1/2" RBP, RET HEAD, 4' TBG 
SUB, 4-1/2" PKR AND RIH W/ TBG. FILL HOLE W/ 
21.5 BBL.
#1- SET RBP AT 1890' AND PKR AT 1856'. ZONE 
1860'-75'. BD 1200#. PMP 1.5 BPM AT 1350#. 
START TO COMMUNICATE. PMP 5 BBL.
#2- SET RBP AT 1852' AND PKR AT 1812'. ZONE 
1835-45, 1820-30. PUMP INTO AT 900#. PMP 3.25 
BPM AT 1300#. PMP 2.5 BBL THEN START TO 
COMMUNICATE. 
#3- SET RBP AT 1809' AND PKR AT 1780'. ZONE 
1786'-95'. BD 1300#. PMP 1.75  BPM AT 1500#. 
START TO COMMUNICATE. PMP 3.25 BBL. 
#4- SET RBP AT 1781' AND PKR AT 1714'. BD 
1300#. PMP 4 BPM AT 1400#. PMP 4 BBL. PMP 
TOTAL OF 36.25 BBL FLUID. RELEASE TOOLS 
AND POOH. LD PKR AND PLUG.

3.5010:30 7:00 -
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Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date:

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD Start Date: 7/8/2010 End Date: 7/19/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft(above Mean Sea Level) UWl: CIGE 80D

Date Time Duration Phase Code Sub P/U MD From Operation
Start-End (hr) Code (ft)

11:30 - 13:00 1.50 WOIREP 37 C P MIRU CUTTERS. RIH W/ 3-1/8" EXP GUN (23
GRAM, 33" PENT, .35 EHD, 90*, 4 SPF) AND PERF
BIRDS NEST 1835'-45'. RD CUTTERS.

13:00 - 14:00 1.00 WOIREP 31 I P RIH W/ NOTCHED 1.87"XN ON 57-JTS 2-3/8" J-55
TBG. PU 7" 5K HANGER AND LAND 57-JTS W/ EOT
AT 1807.91'. RD FLOOR. ND BOP. NU WH. RU
FLOOR TO SWAB.

14:00 - 15:30 1.50 WOIREP 42 B P MAKE 10 MORE SWAB RUNS. IFL 1300', FFL 1760'.
PULLED CUMM 23.9 BBL, 1.7 BBL LTR. HAVE NO
ENTRY.

15:30 - 15:30 0.00 WOIREP 40 B P FILL HOLE WI25 BBL. SPOT ACID TO EOT. BD
PERFS AT 1200 PSI. INJ 20 BBLS, 3 BPM AT 1500
PSI. ISIP 500. CUMM TO RECOVER NOW 73 BBL.

15:30 - 17:30 2.00 WOIREP 42 B P CONT SWABBING. MAKE 10 MORE RUNS. IFL
SURFACE, FFL 1400'. REC 22 BBLS. CUMM
TOTALS FOR DAY- RECOVER 45.88, LTR 27.15.

7/14/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WO/REP 48 P JSA- SWABBING
6:45 - 12:00 5.25 WOIREP 42 B P SICP 0. CONT TO SWAB. MAKE 17-RUNS. IFL

1300', FFL 1760', RECOVERED 2.67 BBL TODAY,
GETTING MAYBE2 GAL BACK ON RUN. CUMM
TOTAL RECOVERED 49.8 BBL OF 73 BBL. LTR 23.2
BBL. RD SWAB.

12:00 - 14:30 2.50 WOIREP 31 I P ND WH. NU BOP. RU FLOOR AND TBG EQUIP.
PULL AND LD 7" HANGER. POOH WI 57-JTS TBG.
PMP 11.5 BBL BACK INTO WELL FOR
PERFERATING. ND SH. SDFN

7/15/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- PERF, RIH, SWAB.
6:45 - 9:00 2.25 WOIREP 37 C P SICP 200. BWD. RU CUTTERS. RIH WI 3-1/8" EXP

GUN (23 GRAM, .35" EHD, 33" PENT, 3 SPF ON
120*) AND PERF BIRDS NEST
1860'-75', 15' ZONE, 45 HOLES.
1820'-30', 10' ZONE, 30 HOLES.
1786'-95', 9' ZONE, 27 HOLES.
1755'-75', 20' ZONE, 60 HOLES.
1728'-50', 22' ZONE, 66 HOLES.
RD CUTTERS

9:00 - 10:00 1.00 WOIREP 31 I P MU NOTCHED 1.87"XN AND RIH W/ 57-JTS TBG.
EOT AT 1807;. RU SWAB.

10:00 - 15:30 5.50 WOIREP 42 B P MAKE23-SWAB RUNS. IFL 850', FFL 1780'.
RECOVER 16.75 BBL TODAY. CUMM TOTALS
LOAD 85.5, RCVR 66.5 BBL, LTR 19 BBL. SDFN

7/16/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- SWABBING. TRIPPING. RUNNING PKR AND
PLUG. PUMPING PRESSURES.

6:45 - 7:00 0.25 WOIREP 31 I P SICP 0. MAKE 1 SWAB RUN. FL 1720'. RD SWAB.
POOH W/ 57-JTS.

7:00 - 10:30 3.50 WOIREP 31 I P PU AND RIN Wl4-1/2" RBP, RET HEAD, 4' TBG
SUB, 4-1/2" PKR AND RIH WI TBG. FILL HOLE WI
21.5 BBL.
#1- SET RBP AT 1890' AND PKR AT 1856'. ZONE
1860'-75'. BD 1200#. PMP 1.5 BPM AT 1350#.
START TO COMMUNICATE. PMP 5 BBL.
#2- SET RBP AT 1852' AND PKR AT 1812'. ZONE
1835-45, 1820-30. PUMP INTO AT 900#. PMP 3.25
BPM AT 1300#. PMP2.5 BBL THEN START TO
COMMUNICATE.
#3- SET RBP AT 1809' AND PKR AT 1780'. ZONE
1786'-95'. BD 1300#. PMP 1.75 BPM AT 1500#.
START TO COMMUNICATE. PMP 3.25 BBL.
#4- SET RBP AT 1781' AND PKR AT 1714'. BD
1300#. PMP 4 BPM AT 1400#. PMP 4 BBL. PMP
TOTAL OF 36.25 BBL FLUID. RELEASE TOOLS
AND POOH. LD PKR AND PLUG.
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Operation Summary Report
Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date:

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD Start Date: 7/8/2010 End Date: 7/19/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft(above Mean Sea Level) UWl: CIGE 80D

Date Time Duration Phase Code Sub P/U MD From Operation
Start-End (hr) Code (ft)

11:30 - 13:00 1.50 WOIREP 37 C P MIRU CUTTERS. RIH W/ 3-1/8" EXP GUN (23
GRAM, 33" PENT, .35 EHD, 90*, 4 SPF) AND PERF
BIRDS NEST 1835'-45'. RD CUTTERS.

13:00 - 14:00 1.00 WOIREP 31 I P RIH W/ NOTCHED 1.87"XN ON 57-JTS 2-3/8" J-55
TBG. PU 7" 5K HANGER AND LAND 57-JTS W/ EOT
AT 1807.91'. RD FLOOR. ND BOP. NU WH. RU
FLOOR TO SWAB.

14:00 - 15:30 1.50 WOIREP 42 B P MAKE 10 MORE SWAB RUNS. IFL 1300', FFL 1760'.
PULLED CUMM 23.9 BBL, 1.7 BBL LTR. HAVE NO
ENTRY.

15:30 - 15:30 0.00 WOIREP 40 B P FILL HOLE WI25 BBL. SPOT ACID TO EOT. BD
PERFS AT 1200 PSI. INJ 20 BBLS, 3 BPM AT 1500
PSI. ISIP 500. CUMM TO RECOVER NOW 73 BBL.

15:30 - 17:30 2.00 WOIREP 42 B P CONT SWABBING. MAKE 10 MORE RUNS. IFL
SURFACE, FFL 1400'. REC 22 BBLS. CUMM
TOTALS FOR DAY- RECOVER 45.88, LTR 27.15.

7/14/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WO/REP 48 P JSA- SWABBING
6:45 - 12:00 5.25 WOIREP 42 B P SICP 0. CONT TO SWAB. MAKE 17-RUNS. IFL

1300', FFL 1760', RECOVERED 2.67 BBL TODAY,
GETTING MAYBE2 GAL BACK ON RUN. CUMM
TOTAL RECOVERED 49.8 BBL OF 73 BBL. LTR 23.2
BBL. RD SWAB.

12:00 - 14:30 2.50 WOIREP 31 I P ND WH. NU BOP. RU FLOOR AND TBG EQUIP.
PULL AND LD 7" HANGER. POOH WI 57-JTS TBG.
PMP 11.5 BBL BACK INTO WELL FOR
PERFERATING. ND SH. SDFN

7/15/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- PERF, RIH, SWAB.
6:45 - 9:00 2.25 WOIREP 37 C P SICP 200. BWD. RU CUTTERS. RIH WI 3-1/8" EXP

GUN (23 GRAM, .35" EHD, 33" PENT, 3 SPF ON
120*) AND PERF BIRDS NEST
1860'-75', 15' ZONE, 45 HOLES.
1820'-30', 10' ZONE, 30 HOLES.
1786'-95', 9' ZONE, 27 HOLES.
1755'-75', 20' ZONE, 60 HOLES.
1728'-50', 22' ZONE, 66 HOLES.
RD CUTTERS

9:00 - 10:00 1.00 WOIREP 31 I P MU NOTCHED 1.87"XN AND RIH W/ 57-JTS TBG.
EOT AT 1807;. RU SWAB.

10:00 - 15:30 5.50 WOIREP 42 B P MAKE23-SWAB RUNS. IFL 850', FFL 1780'.
RECOVER 16.75 BBL TODAY. CUMM TOTALS
LOAD 85.5, RCVR 66.5 BBL, LTR 19 BBL. SDFN

7/16/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- SWABBING. TRIPPING. RUNNING PKR AND
PLUG. PUMPING PRESSURES.

6:45 - 7:00 0.25 WOIREP 31 I P SICP 0. MAKE 1 SWAB RUN. FL 1720'. RD SWAB.
POOH W/ 57-JTS.

7:00 - 10:30 3.50 WOIREP 31 I P PU AND RIN Wl4-1/2" RBP, RET HEAD, 4' TBG
SUB, 4-1/2" PKR AND RIH WI TBG. FILL HOLE WI
21.5 BBL.
#1- SET RBP AT 1890' AND PKR AT 1856'. ZONE
1860'-75'. BD 1200#. PMP 1.5 BPM AT 1350#.
START TO COMMUNICATE. PMP 5 BBL.
#2- SET RBP AT 1852' AND PKR AT 1812'. ZONE
1835-45, 1820-30. PUMP INTO AT 900#. PMP 3.25
BPM AT 1300#. PMP2.5 BBL THEN START TO
COMMUNICATE.
#3- SET RBP AT 1809' AND PKR AT 1780'. ZONE
1786'-95'. BD 1300#. PMP 1.75 BPM AT 1500#.
START TO COMMUNICATE. PMP 3.25 BBL.
#4- SET RBP AT 1781' AND PKR AT 1714'. BD
1300#. PMP 4 BPM AT 1400#. PMP 4 BBL. PMP
TOTAL OF 36.25 BBL FLUID. RELEASE TOOLS
AND POOH. LD PKR AND PLUG.
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12:00 - 14:30 2.50 WOIREP 31 I P ND WH. NU BOP. RU FLOOR AND TBG EQUIP.
PULL AND LD 7" HANGER. POOH WI 57-JTS TBG.
PMP 11.5 BBL BACK INTO WELL FOR
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7/15/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- PERF, RIH, SWAB.
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GUN (23 GRAM, .35" EHD, 33" PENT, 3 SPF ON
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1820'-30', 10' ZONE, 30 HOLES.
1786'-95', 9' ZONE, 27 HOLES.
1755'-75', 20' ZONE, 60 HOLES.
1728'-50', 22' ZONE, 66 HOLES.
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9:00 - 10:00 1.00 WOIREP 31 I P MU NOTCHED 1.87"XN AND RIH W/ 57-JTS TBG.
EOT AT 1807;. RU SWAB.

10:00 - 15:30 5.50 WOIREP 42 B P MAKE23-SWAB RUNS. IFL 850', FFL 1780'.
RECOVER 16.75 BBL TODAY. CUMM TOTALS
LOAD 85.5, RCVR 66.5 BBL, LTR 19 BBL. SDFN

7/16/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- SWABBING. TRIPPING. RUNNING PKR AND
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6:45 - 7:00 0.25 WOIREP 31 I P SICP 0. MAKE 1 SWAB RUN. FL 1720'. RD SWAB.
POOH W/ 57-JTS.

7:00 - 10:30 3.50 WOIREP 31 I P PU AND RIN Wl4-1/2" RBP, RET HEAD, 4' TBG
SUB, 4-1/2" PKR AND RIH WI TBG. FILL HOLE WI
21.5 BBL.
#1- SET RBP AT 1890' AND PKR AT 1856'. ZONE
1860'-75'. BD 1200#. PMP 1.5 BPM AT 1350#.
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#2- SET RBP AT 1852' AND PKR AT 1812'. ZONE
1835-45, 1820-30. PUMP INTO AT 900#. PMP 3.25
BPM AT 1300#. PMP2.5 BBL THEN START TO
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#3- SET RBP AT 1809' AND PKR AT 1780'. ZONE
1786'-95'. BD 1300#. PMP 1.75 BPM AT 1500#.
START TO COMMUNICATE. PMP 3.25 BBL.
#4- SET RBP AT 1781' AND PKR AT 1714'. BD
1300#. PMP 4 BPM AT 1400#. PMP 4 BBL. PMP
TOTAL OF 36.25 BBL FLUID. RELEASE TOOLS
AND POOH. LD PKR AND PLUG.

1/5/2011 11:25:16AM 2

RECEIVED January 05,



US ROCKIES REGION

Operation Summary Report
Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date: 

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD End Date: 7/19/2010Start Date: 7/8/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft (above Mean Sea Level) UWI: CIGE 80D

     Time     
Start-End

MD From
(ft)

Code Sub 
Code

P/U OperationPhaseDuration
(hr)

Date

WO/REP 31 I P RIH W/ NOTCHED 1.87" XN AND 57-JTS 2-3/8" J-55 
TBG. PU 7" 5K HANGER. LAND W/ EOT AT 1819'. 
RD FLOOR. ND BOP. NU WH. RU FLOOR AND 
SWAB EQUIP.

2.0012:3010:30 -

WO/REP 42 B P SWAB. MAKE 26 RUNS AFTER BD. IFL SURFACE. 
FFL 1780' (DRY, MAKING 1/2 HR RUNS). RECOVER
27.7 BBL TODAY. LOAD 121.7. RCVR 94.6, LTR 
27.1. RD SWAB. SDFN.

2.0014:3012:30 -

7/17/2010 WO/REP 48 P JSA- SWABBING. RDSU. RUSU. POOH.0.25 6:45 6:30 -
WO/REP 42 B P SICP 300 PSI. BWD. CONT SWAB. MAKE 7 RUNS. 

IFL 1500'. FFL 1720'. SWAB DRY. RECOVER 1.9 
BBL TODAY. CUMM TOTAL= LOAD 121.7, RCVR 
96.5, LTR 25.2. RD SWAB. RDSU. MOVE OFF.

TBG DETAIL      KB                  15.00
7" 5K HANGER                          1.00
57-JTS 2-3/8" J-55 TBG       1801.86
NOTCHED 1.87" XN                    1.05
    EOT                                   1819.91

1.75 8:30 6:45 -

8/12/2010 CIGE 80D
REPORT FOR TODAY, AUG. 12, 2010

BEGINNING CSG PRESS                 150
BEGINNING TBG PRESS                 200
BEGINNING F.L.                                1100

ENDING TBG PRESS                         0
ENDING CSG PRESS                         0
ENDIG F.L.                                           1810       

TOTAL RUNS FOR DAY                    10

TOTAL RECOVERY                             7 BBLS

-

8/13/2010 CIGE 80D
REPORT FOR TODAY, AUG. 13, 2010

BEGINNING CSG PRESS                 100
BEGINNING TBG PRESS                   15

ENDING TBG PRESS                         0
ENDING CSG PRESS                         0
ENDIG F.L.                                           1810       

TOTAL RUNS FOR DAY                    11

TOTAL RECOVERY                             0 BBLS

-

8/16/2010 -

CIGE 80D
REPORT FOR TODAY, AUG. 16, 2010

BEGINNING CSG PRESS                  90
BEGINNING TBG PRESS                   10

ENDING TBG PRESS                         20
ENDING CSG PRESS                          3
ENDIG F.L.                                           1810       

TOTAL RUNS FOR DAY                    2

TOTAL RECOVERY                         2.4 BBLS

-
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Operation Summary Report
Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date:

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD Start Date: 7/8/2010 End Date: 7/19/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft(above Mean Sea Level) UWl: CIGE 80D

Date Time Duration Phase Code Sub P/U MD From Operation
Start-End (hr) Code (ft)

10:30 - 12:30 2.00 WO/REP 31 I P RIH W/ NOTCHED 1.87" XN AND 57-JTS 2-3/8" J-55
TBG. PU 7" 5K HANGER. LANDWI EOT AT 1819'.
RD FLOOR. ND BOP. NU WH. RU FLOOR AND
SWAB EQUIP.

12:30 - 14:30 2.00 WOIREP 42 B P SWAB. MAKE26 RUNS AFTER BD. IFL SURFACE.
FFL 1780' (DRY, MAKING 1/2 HR RUNS). RECOVER
27.7 BBL TODAY. LOAD 121.7. RCVR 94.6, LTR
27.1. RD SWAB. SDFN.

7/17/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- SWABBING. RDSU. RUSU. POOH.
6:45 - 8:30 1.75 WOIREP 42 B P SICP 300 PSI. BWD. CONT SWAB. MAKE7 RUNS.

IFL 1500'. FFL 1720'. SWAB DRY. RECOVER 1.9
BBL TODAY. CUMM TOTAL= LOAD 121.7, RCVR
96.5, LTR 25.2. RD SWAB. RDSU. MOVE OFF.

TBG DETAIL KB 15.00
7" 5K HANGER 1.00
57-JTS 2-3/8" J-55 TBG 1801.86
NOTCHED 1.87" XN 1.05

EOT 1819.91
8/12/2010 - CIGE 80D

REPORT FOR TODAY, AUG. 12, 2010

BEGINNING CSG PRESS 150
BEGINNING TBG PRESS 200
BEGINNING F.L. 1100

ENDING TBG PRESS 0
ENDING CSG PRESS 0
ENDIG F.L. 1810

TOTAL RUNS FOR DAY 10

TOTAL RECOVERY 7 BBLS
8/13/2010 - CIGE 80D

REPORT FOR TODAY, AUG. 13, 2010

BEGINNING CSG PRESS 100
BEGINNING TBG PRESS 15

ENDING TBG PRESS 0
ENDING CSG PRESS 0
ENDIG F.L. 1810

TOTAL RUNS FOR DAY 11

TOTAL RECOVERY 0 BBLS
8/16/2010

CIGE 80D
REPORT FOR TODAY, AUG. 16, 2010

BEGINNING CSG PRESS 90
BEGINNING TBG PRESS 10

ENDING TBG PRESS 20
ENDING CSG PRESS 3
ENDIG F.L. 1810

TOTAL RUNS FOR DAY 2

TOTAL RECOVERY 2.4 BBLS
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TBG. PU 7" 5K HANGER. LANDWI EOT AT 1819'.
RD FLOOR. ND BOP. NU WH. RU FLOOR AND
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12:30 - 14:30 2.00 WOIREP 42 B P SWAB. MAKE26 RUNS AFTER BD. IFL SURFACE.
FFL 1780' (DRY, MAKING 1/2 HR RUNS). RECOVER
27.7 BBL TODAY. LOAD 121.7. RCVR 94.6, LTR
27.1. RD SWAB. SDFN.

7/17/2010 6:30 - 6:45 0.25 WOIREP 48 P JSA- SWABBING. RDSU. RUSU. POOH.
6:45 - 8:30 1.75 WOIREP 42 B P SICP 300 PSI. BWD. CONT SWAB. MAKE7 RUNS.

IFL 1500'. FFL 1720'. SWAB DRY. RECOVER 1.9
BBL TODAY. CUMM TOTAL= LOAD 121.7, RCVR
96.5, LTR 25.2. RD SWAB. RDSU. MOVE OFF.

TBG DETAIL KB 15.00
7" 5K HANGER 1.00
57-JTS 2-3/8" J-55 TBG 1801.86
NOTCHED 1.87" XN 1.05

EOT 1819.91
8/12/2010 - CIGE 80D

REPORT FOR TODAY, AUG. 12, 2010

BEGINNING CSG PRESS 150
BEGINNING TBG PRESS 200
BEGINNING F.L. 1100

ENDING TBG PRESS 0
ENDING CSG PRESS 0
ENDIG F.L. 1810

TOTAL RUNS FOR DAY 10

TOTAL RECOVERY 7 BBLS
8/13/2010 - CIGE 80D

REPORT FOR TODAY, AUG. 13, 2010

BEGINNING CSG PRESS 100
BEGINNING TBG PRESS 15

ENDING TBG PRESS 0
ENDING CSG PRESS 0
ENDIG F.L. 1810

TOTAL RUNS FOR DAY 11

TOTAL RECOVERY 0 BBLS
8/16/2010

CIGE 80D
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BEGINNING TBG PRESS 10

ENDING TBG PRESS 20
ENDING CSG PRESS 3
ENDIG F.L. 1810
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TOTAL RECOVERY 2.4 BBLS
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12:30 - 14:30 2.00 WOIREP 42 B P SWAB. MAKE26 RUNS AFTER BD. IFL SURFACE.
FFL 1780' (DRY, MAKING 1/2 HR RUNS). RECOVER
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27.1. RD SWAB. SDFN.
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TBG DETAIL KB 15.00
7" 5K HANGER 1.00
57-JTS 2-3/8" J-55 TBG 1801.86
NOTCHED 1.87" XN 1.05

EOT 1819.91
8/12/2010 - CIGE 80D

REPORT FOR TODAY, AUG. 12, 2010

BEGINNING CSG PRESS 150
BEGINNING TBG PRESS 200
BEGINNING F.L. 1100

ENDING TBG PRESS 0
ENDING CSG PRESS 0
ENDIG F.L. 1810

TOTAL RUNS FOR DAY 10

TOTAL RECOVERY 7 BBLS
8/13/2010 - CIGE 80D

REPORT FOR TODAY, AUG. 13, 2010

BEGINNING CSG PRESS 100
BEGINNING TBG PRESS 15

ENDING TBG PRESS 0
ENDING CSG PRESS 0
ENDIG F.L. 1810
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US ROCKIES REGION

Operation Summary Report
Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date: 

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD End Date: 7/19/2010Start Date: 7/8/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft (above Mean Sea Level) UWI: CIGE 80D

     Time     
Start-End

MD From
(ft)

Code Sub 
Code

P/U OperationPhaseDuration
(hr)

Date

12/27/2010 05:30-6:30 RCTL HSM. CHAIN UP ALL EQUIPMENT 
RRTL WITH PUMP & TANK. MIRU BWD. NDWH 
NUBOP. R/U FLOOR & UNLAND TBG. R/U SWAB 
IFL 1500'. TOH 57 JNTS. HAD 200' +/- OF SANDLINE
& SWAB TOOLS IN TBG. R/U CASEDHOLE 
PUMPED 10 BBLS T-MAC FL @ 960'.  PERF CSG @
1717-1723, 1674-1690, 1647-1651 & 1630-1635 WITH
4 SPF. R/D WL. TIH TALLYING 56 JNTS TO 1773'. 
R/U SWAB IFL 900' FFL 1700 RECOVERED 10.87 
BBLS. R/D SWAB SWI SDFN RCTY.

COST = $4344.00 RIG
              $6000.00 WIRELINE

-

12/28/2010 -

05:30-5:00 RCTL HSM. TOH TBG. TIH PKR & RBP 
R/U NALCO HSM BREAK DOWN ALL 4 SETS OF 
PERFS WITH 4 SEPERATE SETTINGS OF TOOLS 
PUMPED3 BBLOF 28% ACID FOLLOWED BY 10 
BBLS INTO EACH SET OF PERFS. TOP 2 SETS 
WENT ON VACUUM. TOH TBG & TOOLS. TIH 52 
JNTS = EOT @ 1641'. SWI R/U SWAB.  PUMPED 85 
TOTAL BBLS, FLOWBACK 12.5 BBLS = 72.5 BBLS 
LEFT TO RECOVER. SDFN RCTY.

COST = $4075.00
              $3456.40  WEATHERFORD

-

12/29/2010 05:30-7:00 RCTL HSM. IFL 250'. UNABLE TO GET 
DOWN WITH 2 CUPS CHANGE TO 1 CUP. RIH 
FOUND BAD SPOT IN SANDLINE CUT OFF 500' OF 
LINE RE-HEAD LINE. MADE 1 RUN WELL KICKED 
OFF FLOW BACK 27.5 BBLS. MADE 3 MORE RUNS 
LOTS OF GAS VERY HARD TO GET DOWN. 
LOWER TBG TO 1707' MADE 32 RUNS TOTAL 
RECOVERED 118.5 BBLS TOTAL = 46.5 FROM 
FORMATION. SENT IN 6 SAMPLES TO NALCO SWI 
SDFN

SAMPLES AS FOLLOWS: #1 + 2.5 BBLS,  #2 + 17.62
BBLS, #3 + 32.62 BBLS,  #4 + 40.87 BBLS, #5 + 43.87
BBLS, #6 + 46.5 BBLS

COST = $4303.00

-

12/30/2010 -
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Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date:

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD Start Date: 7/8/2010 End Date: 7/19/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft(above Mean Sea Level) UWl: CIGE 80D

Date Time Duration Phase Code Sub P/U MD From Operation
Start-End (hr) Code (ft)

12/27/2010 - 05:30-6:30 RCTL HSM. CHAIN UP ALL EQUIPMENT
RRTL WITH PUMP & TANK. MIRU BWD. NDWH
NUBOP. R/U FLOOR & UNLANDTBG. RIU SWAB
IFL 1500'. TOH 57 JNTS. HAD 200' +/- OF SANDLINE
& SWAB TOOLS IN TBG. R/U CASEDHOLE
PUMPED 10 BBLS T-MAC FL @960'. PERF CSG @
1717-1723, 1674-1690, 1647-1651 & 1630-1635 WITE
4 SPF. R/D WL. TlH TALLYlNG 56 JNTS TO 1773'.
RIU SWAB IFL 900' FFL 1700 RECOVERED 10.87
BBLS. R/D SWAB SWI SDFN RCTY.

COST = $4344.00RIG
$6000.00WIRELINE

12/28/2010
05:30-5:00 RCTL HSM. TOH TBG. TIH PKR & RBP
RIU NALCO HSM BREAK DOWN ALL 4 SETS OF
PERFS WITH 4 SEPERATE SETTINGS OF TOOLS
PUMPED3 BBLOF 28% ACID FOLLOWED BY 10
BBLS INTO EACH SET OF PERFS. TOP 2 SETS
WENT ON VACUUM. TOH TBG &TOOLS. TlH 52
JNTS = EOT @ 1641'. SWI R/U SWAB. PUMPED 85
TOTAL BBLS, FLOWBACK 12.5 BBLS = 72.5 BBLS
LEFT TO RECOVER. SDFN RCTY.

COST = $4075.00
$3456.40 WEATHERFORD

12/29/2010 - 05:30-7:00 RCTL HSM. IFL 250'. UNABLE TO GET
DOWN WITH 2 CUPS CHANGE TO 1 CUP. RIH
FOUND BAD SPOT IN SANDLINE CUT OFF 500' OF
LINE RE-HEAD LINE. MADE 1 RUN WELL KICKED
OFF FLOW BACK 27.5 BBLS. MADE 3 MORE RUNS
LOTS OF GAS VERY HARD TO GET DOWN.
LOWER TBG TO 1707' MADE 32 RUNS TOTAL
RECOVERED 118.5 BBLS TOTAL = 46.5 FROM
FORMATION. SENT IN 6 SAMPLES TO NALCO SWI
SDFN

SAMPLES AS FOLLOWS: #1 + 2.5 BBLS, #2 + 17.62
BBLS, #3 + 32.62 BBLS, #4 + 40.87 BBLS, #5 + 43.8
BBLS, #6 + 46.5 BBLS

COST = $4303.00
12/30/2010

1/5/2011 11:25:16AM 4

RECEIVED January 05,

US ROCKIES REGION

Operation Summary Report
Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date:

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD Start Date: 7/8/2010 End Date: 7/19/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft(above Mean Sea Level) UWl: CIGE 80D

Date Time Duration Phase Code Sub P/U MD From Operation
Start-End (hr) Code (ft)

12/27/2010 - 05:30-6:30 RCTL HSM. CHAIN UP ALL EQUIPMENT
RRTL WITH PUMP & TANK. MIRU BWD. NDWH
NUBOP. R/U FLOOR & UNLANDTBG. RIU SWAB
IFL 1500'. TOH 57 JNTS. HAD 200' +/- OF SANDLINE
& SWAB TOOLS IN TBG. R/U CASEDHOLE
PUMPED 10 BBLS T-MAC FL @960'. PERF CSG @
1717-1723, 1674-1690, 1647-1651 & 1630-1635 WITE
4 SPF. R/D WL. TlH TALLYlNG 56 JNTS TO 1773'.
RIU SWAB IFL 900' FFL 1700 RECOVERED 10.87
BBLS. R/D SWAB SWI SDFN RCTY.

COST = $4344.00RIG
$6000.00WIRELINE

12/28/2010
05:30-5:00 RCTL HSM. TOH TBG. TIH PKR & RBP
RIU NALCO HSM BREAK DOWN ALL 4 SETS OF
PERFS WITH 4 SEPERATE SETTINGS OF TOOLS
PUMPED3 BBLOF 28% ACID FOLLOWED BY 10
BBLS INTO EACH SET OF PERFS. TOP 2 SETS
WENT ON VACUUM. TOH TBG &TOOLS. TlH 52
JNTS = EOT @ 1641'. SWI R/U SWAB. PUMPED 85
TOTAL BBLS, FLOWBACK 12.5 BBLS = 72.5 BBLS
LEFT TO RECOVER. SDFN RCTY.

COST = $4075.00
$3456.40 WEATHERFORD

12/29/2010 - 05:30-7:00 RCTL HSM. IFL 250'. UNABLE TO GET
DOWN WITH 2 CUPS CHANGE TO 1 CUP. RIH
FOUND BAD SPOT IN SANDLINE CUT OFF 500' OF
LINE RE-HEAD LINE. MADE 1 RUN WELL KICKED
OFF FLOW BACK 27.5 BBLS. MADE 3 MORE RUNS
LOTS OF GAS VERY HARD TO GET DOWN.
LOWER TBG TO 1707' MADE 32 RUNS TOTAL
RECOVERED 118.5 BBLS TOTAL = 46.5 FROM
FORMATION. SENT IN 6 SAMPLES TO NALCO SWI
SDFN

SAMPLES AS FOLLOWS: #1 + 2.5 BBLS, #2 + 17.62
BBLS, #3 + 32.62 BBLS, #4 + 40.87 BBLS, #5 + 43.8
BBLS, #6 + 46.5 BBLS

COST = $4303.00
12/30/2010

1/5/2011 11:25:16AM 4

RECEIVED January 05,

US ROCKIES REGION

Operation Summary Report
Well: CIGE 80D Spud Date:

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: CIGE 80D Rig Name No: LEED 733/733

Event: RECOMPL/RESEREVEADD Start Date: 7/8/2010 End Date: 7/19/2010
Active Datum: RKB @0.00ft(above Mean Sea Level) UWl: CIGE 80D

Date Time Duration Phase Code Sub P/U MD From Operation
Start-End (hr) Code (ft)

12/27/2010 - 05:30-6:30 RCTL HSM. CHAIN UP ALL EQUIPMENT
RRTL WITH PUMP & TANK. MIRU BWD. NDWH
NUBOP. R/U FLOOR & UNLANDTBG. RIU SWAB
IFL 1500'. TOH 57 JNTS. HAD 200' +/- OF SANDLINE
& SWAB TOOLS IN TBG. R/U CASEDHOLE
PUMPED 10 BBLS T-MAC FL @960'. PERF CSG @
1717-1723, 1674-1690, 1647-1651 & 1630-1635 WITE
4 SPF. R/D WL. TlH TALLYlNG 56 JNTS TO 1773'.
RIU SWAB IFL 900' FFL 1700 RECOVERED 10.87
BBLS. R/D SWAB SWI SDFN RCTY.

COST = $4344.00RIG
$6000.00WIRELINE

12/28/2010
05:30-5:00 RCTL HSM. TOH TBG. TIH PKR & RBP
RIU NALCO HSM BREAK DOWN ALL 4 SETS OF
PERFS WITH 4 SEPERATE SETTINGS OF TOOLS
PUMPED3 BBLOF 28% ACID FOLLOWED BY 10
BBLS INTO EACH SET OF PERFS. TOP 2 SETS
WENT ON VACUUM. TOH TBG &TOOLS. TlH 52
JNTS = EOT @ 1641'. SWI R/U SWAB. PUMPED 85
TOTAL BBLS, FLOWBACK 12.5 BBLS = 72.5 BBLS
LEFT TO RECOVER. SDFN RCTY.

COST = $4075.00
$3456.40 WEATHERFORD

12/29/2010 - 05:30-7:00 RCTL HSM. IFL 250'. UNABLE TO GET
DOWN WITH 2 CUPS CHANGE TO 1 CUP. RIH
FOUND BAD SPOT IN SANDLINE CUT OFF 500' OF
LINE RE-HEAD LINE. MADE 1 RUN WELL KICKED
OFF FLOW BACK 27.5 BBLS. MADE 3 MORE RUNS
LOTS OF GAS VERY HARD TO GET DOWN.
LOWER TBG TO 1707' MADE 32 RUNS TOTAL
RECOVERED 118.5 BBLS TOTAL = 46.5 FROM
FORMATION. SENT IN 6 SAMPLES TO NALCO SWI
SDFN

SAMPLES AS FOLLOWS: #1 + 2.5 BBLS, #2 + 17.62
BBLS, #3 + 32.62 BBLS, #4 + 40.87 BBLS, #5 + 43.8
BBLS, #6 + 46.5 BBLS

COST = $4303.00
12/30/2010

1/5/2011 11:25:16AM 4

RECEIVED January 05,



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML-22652 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Water Disposal Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CIGE 80D 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047308530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6515  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0870 FNL 1018 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

9/29/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: SWD MONITOR PROGRAM

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The subject well remains a SWD monitor well and is part of the Kerr
McGee/EPA SWD monitoring well program. The operator plans on this well

remaining a SWD well for the next year.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Andy Lytle 720 929-6100

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 9/29/2011

10/20/2011

Sep. 29, 2011

Sundry Number: 18971 API Well Number: 43047308530000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EA22E65DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. NATURAL BUTTES

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Water Disposal Well CIGE 80D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P. 43047308530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6515 E×t NATURAL BUTTES

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0870 FNL 1018 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.05 Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

9/29/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: SWD MONITOR PROQ
12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The subject well remains a SWD monitor well and is part of the Kerr
McGee/EPA SWD monitoring well program. The operator plans on this well

remaining a SWD well for the next year. Approved by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

Dat·e:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Andy Lytle 720 929-6100 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EA22E65DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. NATURAL BUTTES

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Water Disposal Well CIGE 80D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P. 43047308530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6515 E×t NATURAL BUTTES

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0870 FNL 1018 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.05 Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

9/29/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: SWD MONITOR PROQ
12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The subject well remains a SWD monitor well and is part of the Kerr
McGee/EPA SWD monitoring well program. The operator plans on this well

remaining a SWD well for the next year. Approved by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

Dat·e:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Andy Lytle 720 929-6100 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EA22E65DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. NATURAL BUTTES

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Water Disposal Well CIGE 80D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P. 43047308530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6515 E×t NATURAL BUTTES

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0870 FNL 1018 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.05 Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

9/29/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: SWD MONITOR PROQ
12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The subject well remains a SWD monitor well and is part of the Kerr
McGee/EPA SWD monitoring well program. The operator plans on this well

remaining a SWD well for the next year. Approved by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

Dat·e:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Andy Lytle 720 929-6100 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



RECEIVED: Jun. 20, 2013

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML-22652 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Water Disposal Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CIGE 80D 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047308530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6515  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0870 FNL 1018 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

6 /19 /2013

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  SWD Monitor Program

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The subject well remains a SWD monitor well and is part of the Kerr
McGee/EPA SWD monitoring well program. The operator plans on this

well remaining a SWD well for the next year.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Teena Paulo 720 929-6236

TITLE
 Staff Regulatory Specialist

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 6 /20 /2013

August 09, 2013

Sundry Number: 39218 API Well Number: 43047308530000Sundry Number: 39218 API Well Number: 43047308530000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-22652

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. NATURALBUTTES

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Water Disposal Well CIGE 80D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P. 43047308530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6 5NIATIERALBUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0870 FNL 1018 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

6/19/2013
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: SWD Monitor Program

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The subject well remains a SWD monitor well and is part of the Kerr Accepted by the
McGee/EPA SWD monitoring well program. The operator plans on this utah Division of

well remaining a SWD well for the next year. Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: August 09, 2013

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Teena Paulo 720 929-6236 Staff Regulatory Specialist

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 6/20/2013

RECEIVED: Jun. 20,

Sundry Number: 39218 API Well Number: 43047308530000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-22652

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. NATURALBUTTES

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Water Disposal Well CIGE 80D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P. 43047308530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6 5NIATIERALBUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0870 FNL 1018 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

6/19/2013
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: SWD Monitor Program

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The subject well remains a SWD monitor well and is part of the Kerr Accepted by the
McGee/EPA SWD monitoring well program. The operator plans on this utah Division of

well remaining a SWD well for the next year. Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: August 09, 2013

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Teena Paulo 720 929-6236 Staff Regulatory Specialist

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 6/20/2013

RECEIVED: Jun. 20,

Sundry Number: 39218 API Well Number: 43047308530000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-22652

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. NATURALBUTTES

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Water Disposal Well CIGE 80D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P. 43047308530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6 5NIATIERALBUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0870 FNL 1018 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

6/19/2013
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: SWD Monitor Program

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The subject well remains a SWD monitor well and is part of the Kerr Accepted by the
McGee/EPA SWD monitoring well program. The operator plans on this utah Division of

well remaining a SWD well for the next year. Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: August 09, 2013

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Teena Paulo 720 929-6236 Staff Regulatory Specialist

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 6/20/2013

RECEIVED: Jun. 20,



RECEIVED: Sep. 16, 2014

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML-22652 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Test Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CIGE 80D 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047308530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6100  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0870 FNL 1018 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

9 /16 /2014

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  MONITOR WELL

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The CIGE 80D remains a monitor well for the CIGE 114 SWD well as part
of the EPA SWD monitoring well program. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Doreen Green 435 781-9758

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst II

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 9 /16 /2014

September 16, 2014

Sundry Number: 55643 API Well Number: 43047308530000Sundry Number: 55643 API Well Number: 43047308530000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-22652

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. NATURALBUTTES

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Test Well CIGE 80D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P. 43047308530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6 10ATIERALBUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0870 FNL 1018 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

9/16/2014
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: MONITOR WELL

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The CIGE 80D remains a monitor well for the CIGE 114 SWD well as part Accepted by the
of the EPA SWD monitoring well program. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
September 16, 2014

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Doreen Green 435 781-9758 Regulatory Analyst Il

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 9/16/2014

RECEIVED: Sep. 16,

Sundry Number: 55643 API Well Number: 43047308530000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-22652

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. NATURALBUTTES

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Test Well CIGE 80D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P. 43047308530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6 10ATIERALBUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0870 FNL 1018 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

9/16/2014
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: MONITOR WELL

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The CIGE 80D remains a monitor well for the CIGE 114 SWD well as part Accepted by the
of the EPA SWD monitoring well program. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
September 16, 2014

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Doreen Green 435 781-9758 Regulatory Analyst Il

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 9/16/2014

RECEIVED: Sep. 16,



RECEIVED: Sep. 14, 2015

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML-22652 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Test Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CIGE 80D 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047308530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6100  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0870 FNL 1018 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

9 /14 /2015

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  MONITOR WELL

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The CIGE 80D remains a monitor well for the CIGE 114 SWD well as part
of the EPA SWD monitoring well program.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Doreen Green 435 781-9758

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst II

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 9 /14 /2015

September 16, 2015

Sundry Number: 66108 API Well Number: 43047308530000Sundry Number: 66108 API Well Number: 43047308530000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-22652

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. NATURALBUTTES

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Test Well CIGE 80D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P. 43047308530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6 10ATIERALBUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0870 FNL 1018 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

9/14/2015
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENTOR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: MONITOR WELL

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The CIGE 80D remains a monitor well for the CIGE 114 SWD well as part Accepted by the
of the EPA SWD monitoring well program. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
September 16, 2015

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Doreen Green 435 781-9758 Regulatory Analyst Il

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 9/14/2015

RECEIVED: Sep. 14,

Sundry Number: 66108 API Well Number: 43047308530000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-22652

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. NATURALBUTTES

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Test Well CIGE 80D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P. 43047308530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6 10ATIERALBUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0870 FNL 1018 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

9/14/2015
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENTOR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: MONITOR WELL

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The CIGE 80D remains a monitor well for the CIGE 114 SWD well as part Accepted by the
of the EPA SWD monitoring well program. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
September 16, 2015

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Doreen Green 435 781-9758 Regulatory Analyst Il

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 9/14/2015

RECEIVED: Sep. 14,



RECEIVED: Sep. 13, 2016

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML-22652 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Test Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CIGE 80D 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047308530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6456  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0870 FNL 1018 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

9 /13 /2016

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  MONITOR WELL

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The CIGE 80D remains a monitor well for the CIGE 114 SWD well as part
of the EPA SWD monitoring well program.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Candice Barber 435 781-9749

TITLE
 HSE Representative

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 9 /13 /2016

September 16, 2016

Sundry Number: 74393 API Well Number: 43047308530000Sundry Number: 74393 API Well Number: 43047308530000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-22652

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. NATURALBUTTES

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Test Well CIGE 80D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P. 43047308530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6 48ATIERALBUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0870 FNL 1018 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNW Section: 02 Township: 10.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

9/13/2016
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENTOR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: MONITOR WELL

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The CIGE 80D remains a monitor well for the CIGE 114 SWD well as part Accepted by the
of the EPA SWD monitoring well program. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
September 16, 2016

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Candice Barber 435 781-9749 HSE Representative

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 9/13/2016

RECEIVED: Sep. 13,
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