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SUBMIT IN JCATE* Form approved.
Fo-m 9-3310 . Budget Bureau No. 42-R1425.

May 1¾3) (Other instructions on

UNITED STATES reve e side)

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 3. LEASE DESU,NmON AND SMO NO.

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY

PLICATION FOR PERMITTO DRILL,DEEPEN,OR PLUG BACK Û·1FINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRifŒNAME

1 .
TYPE OF WORK

DRILL U DEEPENO PLUG BACK 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYIEOFWELL
GAILL

OTHER
LINGLE O IPLE 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

D e or orsastoa Landey
Bow Valley Petroleum Inc. 9. WELL NO.

n SS OF OPERATOR 1-30 A1E
1700 Broadway, Suite 900, Denver, CO 80290 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

T TION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) East Bluebell , Wasatch

1525' FNL, 2037' FNL (SE/NW) * CD.,ST.,E.,M OILE K.

At proposed prod. zone
Sec, 30, T1S, R1E, USM

DISTANCE IN ÈLES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAllEST TOWN OR POST OFFICE* 12. COUNTY OR PARISH 13. STATE

5 Mi NE of Roosevelt, Utah Uintah | Utah
D1STANCE FROM PROPOSED* 16. NO. OF ACRES IN LEANE 17. NO. OF ACRES ASSIGNED

LOCATION TO NEAREST TO THIS WELL

PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE, FT.
(Also to nearest drlg. unit line, if any) 1525' 600 600 (Proposed)

18 nisTANcE ynon ruoPOSED LOCATION* 19, PROPOSED DEPTH 20. ROTARY OR CABLE TUOLS

TO NEAREST WELL, DRILLING, COMPLETED,

OR APPLIED FOR, ON THIS LEASE "· NA 12,950 Rotary
ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 22. APPROI. DATE WORK WILL START*

5421' GL I September 3, 1980
PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

SIZE OF HOLE SIZE OF CASING WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH QUANTITY OF CEMENT

12¾" 9-5/8" 40 3000 900 sx
8-3/4" 7" 26, 29, 32 10,?nn 600 sx
6" 5" 18 10,100-12,950 600 sx

This application is to drill and complete a well in the Wasatch Formation.
The well is to be drilled vertically with a hole deviation of not more than 1
degree/100 '

.

5000 PSI B0PE will be installed after setting 3000' of surface pipe and used until
completion. It will be initially tested to 1500 PSI and will be tested to 5000
PSI before drilling the 7" csg shoe.

IN AEOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM : If proposal is to deepen or plug back, give data on present productive zone and proposed new productive

zone. If proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give pertinent data on subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths. Give blowout

pr4ev ntN Dpr0 ,

TITLE DiStrict Engineer DATE

(This space for Federal or State office use)

PERMIT NO. APPROVAL DATF

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*SeeInstructionsOn Reverse
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BLO'dOUT PREVENTION EQUIPMENT

BeTT Nipple

Flow Line
Eill Line

Annular
Preventer

Pipe Rams

Blind Rams Adjustable Choke

----To Mud Tanks

Kill Line---- Drilling ----

· --To Flare
Spool Pit

c' To Gas
Casind9 Hydraulic Choke

Minimum 3,000 PSI BOPE is to be installed after setting surface pipe.
All preventers are to be tested to 1500 PSI prior to drilling out casing
shoe.

Minimum 5,000 PSI 80PE is to be installed after setting the long string.
The pipe rams and blind rams are to be tested to 5,000 PSI and the annular
preventer to 1,500 PSI prior to drilling out shoe.

All a#xillary B0PE will be tested to appropriate pressures when 80P'S
are tested. (Manifold, upper and lower Kelly cocks, valves, and inside BOP).

After drilling the shoe, the casing seat will be pressure tested to
an equivalent mud weight of 13.5
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Form DOCC-la SUBMIT IN T. -lCATE*

STATE OF UTAH
(Othe ru tions on

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES \

DIVISION OF OIL & GAS
an Serial N

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL, DEEPEN, OR PLUG BACK
la. Type of Work nit Agreement Na

DRILL [X) DEEPEN PLUG BACK
b. Type of WeÌl

Oil Gas Single Multiple av or Lease Name

Wel Well Other Zone one

2. Name of Operator L

BOWVALLEYPETROLEUMINC.
" *°

0. Addr s of Operator
1-30 A1E

1700 BROADWAY,SUITE 900, DENVER,COLORADO80290 "' "°'"""""°°'°

4. e ficof Well (Report location clearly and in are dance with ariy State requirements.o
GA&¯Fg MAS TG

1525' FNL, 2037' (Sg
"

si,
"-oh,"i

At proposed prod, zone SEC 30, TlS, R1E, USM
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parrish 13. State

5 MI NE OF ROOSEVELT,UTAH UINTAH UTAH
nee from proposed* 16. No. of acres in lease 17. No. of acres assigned

loe:nion to nearest to this well

property or iesse une. It 1525' 600 600 (Proposed)
(Also to nearest drig. line, if any)

18. sin ef

, th
sn oce

n*°"'

NA 1 5I' T Y
21. Elevations (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.)

22. Approx. date work will start*

5421' SEPTEMBER3, 1980
23. FROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

Size of Hole Size of Casing Weight per Foot Setting Depth Quantity of Cement

12-1/4" 9-5/8" 40 3,000 900 SX
8-3/4" 7" 26, 29, 32 10,200 600 SX
6" 5" 18 10,100-12,950 600 SX

This application is to drill and complete a well in the Wasatch Formation.
The well is to be drilled vertically with a hole deviati¾t more than one
degree/l00' .

5,000 PSI B0PE will be installed after setting 3,000' of surface pipe and used until
completion. It will be initially tested to 1,500 PSI and will be tested to 5,000
PSI before drilling the 7" csg. shoe. PPROVED-BY THE DIVf! »N

F OIL, GAS, AND MINING

IN VE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM: If proposal is to deepen or vlug back, give data on present productive zone and proposed new pro-

ne oas o drill ee ive pertinent lata on suDbsuface locatio s aP

Od

RG ve blowout

his so ce for Federal or State office use)

Permit ... . .. . .
.............. ........... Approval Date .....

Approved by........................ ...............
Title....................... ....

......... Date

Conditions of approval, if any:

*See Instructions On Reverse



(Measured )
S 89°58 00" E 5295.61'

I
2037 ' HD LANDY/-30 A/E

E/ev. Ungraded Ground - 542/'

30
Proposed

Lot 3 Unit
0 600 Acres

i Lot 4

-
um mig q. mmum mmmm - - - - mm um um - r

X = Secticn Corners Located

Bow Valley Exploration (U.S.) Inc.
Western Division

WELLLOCATION,H. D. LANDY1-30 ATE
LOCATEDAS SHOWNIN THE SE 1/4 NW1/4
SECTION30, T15, R1E,U.S.B. &M.
UINTAHCOUNTY,UTAH
SCALE: 1" = 1,000' 7/8/80
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50W VALLEYPETROLEUMINC. 1 DEN 112

DRILLING PROGRAM

Date July 7 , 19_ O_ (Development X Wildcat )

state Utah District Roosevelt

Field East Bluebell Lease Landy Well No. 1-30 A1E

Location 1525' FNL, 2037' FWL Sec 30, T1S, R1E County Uintah

Estimate NO. Est. T.D. 12950 Est. Elev. 5421 Ground
ungraded

FORh"ATION TOPS

Est. Actual Est. Actual
Name Depth Depth Name Depth Depth

Green River 6735

TGR 3 8801

Wasatch 9355

Water Marker 12371

Samples Drilling Time

Interval From To Interval From To

10' 5000' TD l' 7500' TD

CORING None

TESTING PoSSibly one DST in the Green River

LCGGING SERVICES

1" Scale 2" Scale 5" Sdale
Tvoe From To Fram To Fram To

DIL-GR 3000 TD 3000 TD

CNL-FDC-GR 5000 TD

SARABAND 5000 TD

MUDLOG 5000
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POTarIAL DRILLING KMARDS Lost circulation in lower GR & lÊwerWasatch.

Overoressured zones in Wasatch.

110 Native mud surface to 6500'. LSND 7500' - TD weighted as necessary to control

well.

CASING AND TUBING

Eit Casing Cement
From To Size Diameter Wt. Grade Joint Sacks

cond. Surface 40' 20" 75 sx to Surf.

Surf. *Surface 3000 124 9-5/8 40.0# K-55 STC 900 sx to Surf.

Inter-
mediate O 2000 8-3/4" 7" 26.0# S95 LTC

2000 9000 8-3/4" 7" 29.0# S95 LTC

**9000 10,200 8-3/4 7" 32.0# 595 LTC 600 sx 2000'
Fill

Prod. 10,100 12,950 6" 5" 18.0# P110 SPEC 600 sx "G"

Tubing O 10,500 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 EUE

CEMENT PROGRAM

Cement: Cond; "G", surface; Lite & "G", intermediate; lite & "G", liner, "G".

Reciprocate if possible.

Equipment: Differnetial float and float shoe.

COMPLETION PROGRAM

Selectively perforate & acidize.

* Special drift 8.75".
** Special Drift 6.00".

Signed:
D.R.
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SLO'd OUT PREVENTION EQUIPMENT

BeTT NippTe

Flow Line

Annular
Preventer

Pipe Rams

Blind Rams Adjustable Choke
p-F3

. ----To Mud Tanks

Ki31 Line Drilling >< >--=i ---To Flare
Spool Pit

c'] - To Gas
Casind9 Hydraulic Choke Buster

Minimum 3,000 PSI BOPE is to be installed after setting surface pipe.
All preventers are to be tested to 1500 PSI prior to drilling out casing
shoe.

Minimum 5,000 PSI BOPE is to be installed after setting the long string.
The pipe rams and blind rams are to be tested to 5,000 PSI and the annular
preventer to 1,500 PSI prior to drilling out shoe.

All agxiliary BOPE will be tested to appropriate pressures when 80P'S
are tested. (Manifold, upper and lower Kelly cocks, valves, and inside BOP).

After drilling the shoe, the casing seat will be pressure tested to
an equivalent mud weight of 13.5
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PPOJE T

BOW VALLEY PETROLEUM INC.
7¯/ S 77 / E U S. B. 8 M * " '°canon , av ovvor i omm, -

Iocated as shown in the SE l/4 NW I/4
Section 30, TIS, RIE, U.S.B.8 M.
Uintah County, Utah.

(Measured)
S89°58'00"E 5295 6l

Lot /

H D. LANDY /-30 A/E
o o E/ev. Ungraded Ground - 542/m N Lot 2

so
Lo/3

-

uRLo/4

UlNTAH ENGINEERING a LAND SusvFYun
PO BOX Q - 110 EAST - FIRST SOUTH

VERNAL, UTAH - 84078

|

| = 1000 M a yb , 1980
PAPT Y Rt FE HE 40 5

X = Section Corners Locoted R K. D.B. BFW GLO Plot
NEAT HER Fit E

CIncr 9 Worm P il i



** FILE NOTATIONS**

DATE:

OPERATOR:

WELLNO:

Location: Sec. Ô T. /$ R. / County:

F¿te PtepaAed: Entexed on N.I.9i

Caxd Indexed: Complet¿on Sheet:

API Numbe 344) 30 90

CHECKEDBY:

Petroleum Engineer:

Administrative Aide:

APPROVALLETTER:

Bond Requaed: Suxvey Pfa.t Requaed:

OxdeA No 0.K. Rufe C-3

Rule C-3(e)
, Topogxaph¿c Excep,t¿on - company owns ok contAofs acAeage

w¿th,¿n a 660' madius og pAoposed a¿te

Lease Designa,t¿on Plotted on Map

AppAoval LetteA DIA¿tten

Ho-t L¿ne /
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October 29, 1980

Bee Valley Petroleum Inc
1700 Broadway, Suite 900
Denver, Colorado 80290

Re: Well No. Landy 1-3L B
Sec. 30, T. 18, R.
Uintah County, UtaL

Insofar as this of. e is concerned, approval > drill the above
referred to pil well is reby granted in accordant with the Order issued
in Cause No. 131-34 date July 22, 1980.

Should you determi: that it will be necessar .o plug and abandon
this well, you are here requested to immediately tify the following:

MICHABLT. MI R - Petroleum Engineer
Office: 533- 11
Home: 876-30

Enclosed please ti Form OGC-8-1, which is t se completed whether
or not water sands (acq fors) are encountered dur y drilling. Your
cooperation in completi this form will be apprec ced.

Purther, it is req stod that this Division b sotified within 24 hours
after drilling operatio commence, and that the d 111ng contractor and rig
number be identified.

The API number ass med to this well is 43-04 30790.

Sincerely,

DIVISION OF L, GAS, ANDMINING

Cleon 8. Foi at
Director

/ka
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PETROLEUM AND MINING LANDMAN

Box31O

PARKCITY,UTAwastmo

SO1-649-9853on649-8388

November 14, 1980

State of Utah
Department of Natural Resources
Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
1588 West North Temple
Salt Lake City, Utah 84116

Gentlemen:

On November 12, 1980, on behalf of Bow Valley Petroleum Inc., we searched
your producing well files on the following described section:

Township 1 South, Range 1 East, USM
Section 30: All

Our search indicated that this section is not now producing oil and/or gas
and has never been productive of either oil or gas.

Bow Valley is now doing title work and it is very important for Bow Valley
to know that our check of your records of producing wells in this section
is correct. For this reason, we would greatly appreciate it if you would
confirm that our check of your records is correct and note your findings on
the copy of this letter and return it to me.

If you have any questions or desire further information, please phone me
at the above number.

Very truly yours,

J. W. Bloom

Mr. Bloom:

We have carefully checked our files which would show any well capable of
producing either oil or gas in the above mentioned section and could find
no well now being located in the above mentioned section that is capable of
producing either oil or gas. Our files do not show that this section has ever
had a well in it that produced either oil and/or gas. Our files do show thatBow Valley is now drilling a well in t is sectio

b

isi
onf Oil an
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Form OGC-3 SUB.\lIT IN Di,..CATE*
, ' STATE OF UTAH (See other instructions

on reverse side) |
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL DESOURCES API # 43-0,47-30790

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING O. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG *
6. Œ ŒDM AROM OR M NM

la. TYPE OF WELL.
LL LL DRY Other 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF COMPLETION:

r,
ErK DFEP- DIFF.R.

Other S. FARM OR LEASE NAME

2. NAME OF OPERATom Landy
Bow Valley Petroleum Inc. 9. WELL NO.

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR

1700 Broadway, Suite 900, Denver, CO 80290 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements) Bl uebel1
^t surface 1525 ' FNL, 2037 FWL (SE/NW) II. g a., ar.. ox, stoes aso scavar

At top prod. interval reported below

At total depth Sec 30, T1S, R1E, USM
14. PERMIT NO. DATE ISSCED 12. COUNTY OR 13. STATE

43-047-30790 | 10- -80 lii th i Utah
15. DATE SPCDDED I 16. DATE T.D, REACHED 1 . DATE COMPL. (Ready to prod.) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, GE, ETC.)* 1Û. ELEV. CASINGHEAD

9-4-80 10-28-80 11-20-80 | E470 RKS 5464
20. TUTAL DEPTH. MD & TVD 21. PLUG, BACK T.D., MD A TVD 22. IHO 3LTIPLE COMPL., 21 INTLLRVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS

12,950 12,950 All
M. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION-TOP, BOTTOM, NA31E (MD AND TVD). 25. WAS DIRECTDEONAL

Wasatch 11,504-12,900 (150 ft. net, 300 holes) No
26. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN 27. WAS WELL CORED

DII,,-SP-GR FDC-CNL ' No
28 CASING RECORD (Report all strings set in ceu)

SING SIZE WEIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTH 3ET (MD) HOLE SIZE EMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED

9-5/8 40 2992 12's 1255 sx Lite , 200 sx"H' None
7 26,29,& 32 10,200 8-3 4 300 šx 1.ite, 2UU sx "H" None

29 LINER RECORD 30. TUBING RECORD
SIZE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT* SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

5 10,023 12950 800 sx
¯

2 10,092 10,092

31 PERFORATION RECORD (Ittf€rval, Biz€ GWd uttinOfr) 32. ACID. SHOT. FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE. ETC.

See attached DEPTH INTERVAL (MD) AMOUNT .AND KIND OF MATERIAL CSED

11,504-12 0 35,000 qals 15¾ NE-HCL

33 PRODUCTION
DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHoo (Flotoing, gas lift, purnping-size and type of purnp) WELL STATUs (Producing or

8Aut-in)11-20-80 F Iowing Producinq
DATE OF TEST HOERS TESTED CHOKE sitE PROD'N. FOR OIL-BBL, S-MCF. WATER-BBL. GAS-OIL RATIO

11-22-80 | 24 24/64 1548 773 11 499
FLOW. TURING PRESS. CASING PRESSURE CALCC TED DIL -RUL GAS-McF. WATFR-BBL. OIL GRAVITT-API ICORR.)

noo o .

" "
1548 773 11 42

34 DISPoslTION Or GAS (Sold, used for fuel, vente Mc.) TrsT WITNESSED BY

2ŒLMCFPD used for fuel ba anceg\flared Chuck Gardner35 L:3T OF ATTACHMENTS

Perforat'ons
36 I bereby cer yt the to and at information is complete and correct as cae-mined from all available records

SIGNED '
TITLE Di Stri ct Eng i neer 12-4-80

0,H, Mller
*(See Instructionsand Spaces for Additional Data on Reverse
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I onn OGC-lb SUB RIPLICATE*

.TE OF UTAH (Ot r actions on
reve:se side)

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCEs API # 43-047-30790
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
6. lF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRIBE NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

OILLL WABLL
OTHER

2. NAI;E OF OPERATOR 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

Bow Valley Petroleum Inc.
_

Landy
S. Avoares or OPERATOR

.
9. WELL NO.

1700 Broadway, Suite 900, Denver, CO 80290 3-30 A1E
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WlLDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
at surrae• Bl uebel l1525 ' FNL, 2037 ' FWL ( SE/NW) 11. SEC., T., B., M., OR BLE. AND

BURVET OR AREA

Sec. 30, T1S,_Rid2
14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONs (Show whether or, RT, an, eto.) 12. COUNTT 05 PARIGH 18. STATE

43-047-30790 5478 RKB Uintah ........
Utah

16 ChecÍcAppropnate BoxTo Indicate Nature of Notice, Report,or OtherData
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: BUBBBQUENT REPORT OF:

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-Ory REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CIIANGE PLANs (Other) . .. Disposiff n of Gas
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well

(Other) Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)
17. DEscuinE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Cloirly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this work.) *

A gas pipeline connection has been made. As of 12-12-80 the gas is being
sold.

18. I hereby cer yt he for true AL d COrr Ct

SIGNED TITLE DiStrict Engineer DATE
12-29-80

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*Seelustructionson Reverse
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. dF E IN QUADRUPLÏCATE

P A OGC-8-X

STATE OF UTAR
'ARTMENTOP NATURALRESOU BS

D ¾SION OF CIL, GAS, AND MI 4G
1588 West North Temple

Salt Lake City, Utah 841

REPORT I WATERENCOUNTERED DURIN )RILLING

Name 4 Number: _Landy 1-30 A1E

ator: Bow Valley_ Pgroleum Inc Address: 1700 Broadway, Suite 900,
Denver, GU BU/9U

ractor: Chase Drilling Co. Address: One Park Central, Suite 340
Denver, LU BU¿Ut

tion_SE 1 4 NW /4; c. 30 T A N, R 1 E; Uintah County,
S W

r Sands

ge t volume: quality:
To- Flow Rate or Hea Fresh or Salty

None encountered

4

(Continue on Rev se Side if Necessary)

Green River - 6552'
Wasatch - 9245'

Ret ks:

NO7 (a) Upon diminishing : ply of forms, please infi this offices(b'j Report on this fo2 as provided for in Rule ( 0, General Rules andRegulations and Rt s of Practice and Procedt ,

(c) wy gj has been made of the abox reported zone,please forward a e
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1
Bow Valley Ëetggµ pc.

1700 Broadway, Suite 900, Denver, CO 80290

August 198Ìoun zu Telephone: (303) 861-4366
Telecopier: (303) 832-3825
Telex: 45-0033

Kr. Robert N. Long
8197 South Portal Way
Sandy, Utah 84092

RE: Interest of Delma Long
Landy Well
Secs. 19 & 30, TlS-RlE
Uintah County, Utah

Dear Mr. Long:

I have received your letter of August 19, 1981 wherein you indicated
that you filed a Petition with the Utah State Oil, Gas and Mining Division
regarding the above-referenced matter. I have spoken with and written to you
and many of your family members regarding the problem but, apparently, I have
been unsuccessful in communicating to any of you the substance of the problem
regarding the Delma Long interest. Most recently, I wrote Kenneth Long on
August 12, 1981 setting forth all the facts. In any event, I again set forth
these facts for you. By copy of this letter, I am advising the Utah Oil and Gas
Division of the situation.

First, it is not correct, as stated in your letter to Mr. Feight, that
"Bow Valley will not pay because, they say Phillips Petroleum Co. claims they
hold that 40 acres on a lease agreenent, whether it is in the Roosevelt unit or
not". The SW/4SE/4 of Section 19 is outside the Roosevelt Unit and, as stated
below, the Long family will be receiving the appropriate royalty payments. The
significance of the fact that part of Delma Long's holdings were in the
Roosevelt Unit is that Kenneth Long claimed his interest was unleased and,
therefore, he contended he could be a working interest owner in the well.
Accordingly, I explained to Kenneth Long that part of Delma Long's lands that
she leased were held by production. The lease to Phillips was then good and he
did not have an unleased interest.

Second, the reason that the royalty payments for the Long's have been
held in suspense is that Phillips took a lease fram the Federal Farm Mortgage
Corporation for lands in this tract and we could not see where that institution
owned any minerals. We suspended the royalties until we could ascertain whom to
pay and in what amounts. Just this morning, that problem was resolved. The
Federal Farm Mortgage Company conveyed their interest to Winfred Long on
December 12, 1950. Therefore, the Longs will be receiving their interest.

Third, you state that Delma Long is due royalty payments. However,
Kenneth Long and Valois Long Morrill have each sent me a copy of a mineral deed
dated August 12, 1974, whereby Delma long conveyed all her minerals to eight
family members, one of which is Robert N. Long. If you contend that you own
nothing and Delma Long owns all these minerals, please send me documents which
supersede that 1974
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Bow Valley Petroleum Inc.

Mr. Robert N. Long
Page Two
August 24, 1981

Fourth, the grantees of that August 12, 1974 deed shortly will be
receiving Division Orders setting out their interests in this well. When these
are signed and returned to us, we will cause them to be paid. If, however, you
contend that this deed is samehow ineffectual, please advise.

Finally, it is unfortunate that you found it necessary to approach the
Utah Oil and Gas Division with this problem. Both Bow Valley and Phillips have
spent a considerable amount of time and expense to resolve this matter. We have
obtained abstracts and engaged attorneys in this effort. I do not complain
about this, for that is our job. However, I personally spoke with many mEmbers

of the Long family and tried to make clear the problems involved in the title.
These problems were not of our creation and no one has attempted to refuse to
pay the proper people. In fact, Phillips has received no revenue from this well
because of the title problem. I hope that you can appreciate that Bow Valley
does not want to pay royalties to the wrong people. Specifically, I don't think
you would have appreciated it if we had paid the Federal Farm Mortgage Company
instead of the Longs.

I feel that the problEm is now resolved. However, if you wish to
pursue your petition with the State of Utah, we are, of course, prepared to file
with them whatever is necessary.

Yours ve rely,

BDW PETRO C.

nis N. Carn
District Landman

DNC/amb

cc: Mr. Cleon Feight
Oil, Gas and Mining
1588 West North Temple
Salt Lake City, Utah 84116

Mr. Gordon Buchman
PHILLIPS PETROLEUM COMPANY
7800 East Dorado Place
Englewood, Colorado
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DOGM 56-64-2

an equal opportunity employe

UTAH
4 NATURALRESOURCE'

Og, Gas & Mining

355 West North Temple, 3 Triad center, Suite 350, Salt Lake City, Ut
3 584180-1203.Ol801-538-5340)

Page-Of

MONTHLY OIL AND GAS PRODUCTION REPORT

Operator name and address:

*BOW VALLEY PETROLEUM, INC· Utah AccountNo. N0130
1675 BROADWAY, SUITE 2100
DENVER CO 80202 Report Period (Month/Year) 3 / $Ï
ATTN: JUDY WILSON

Amended Report

Well Name Producing Days Production Volume
API Number Entity Location Zone Oper Oil (BBL) Gas (MSCF) Water (BBL)

UTE TRIBAL 1-22A1E
4304730429 00810 015 01E 22 GRRV
LARSEN 1-25Al
4304730552 oo815 015 01W 25 wsTC
DRY GULCH 1-36Al
4304730569 00820 015 01W 36 GRRV
NELSON 1-31AlE
4304730671 00830 015 01E 31 WSTC
UTE TRIBAL 1-32AlE
4304730676 00835 015 01E 32 GR-WS
ROSEMARY LLOYD I-24A lE
4304730707 oo840 ois 01E 24 WSTC

'). LANDY 1-30ATE.
4730790 00845 015 01E 30 WSTC

UTE TAlBAL 1-15AIE
4304730820 00850 ois 01E 15 WSTC
WALKEA1-14AlE
4304730805 00855 015 01E 14 WSTC
UTE TRIBAL 1-17A1E
4304730829 00860 os 01E 17 GRRv
UTE TRIBAL 1-25AlE
4304730830 oo865 015 01E 25 wsTC
FAUSETT 1-26AlE
4304730821 00870 015 01E 26 WSTC
HOUSTON 1-34Z1
4301330566 oo885 01N 01W 34 WSTC

TOTAL

Comments (attach separate sheet if necessary)

I have revievved this report and certify the information to be accurate and complete. Date

. TelephoneAarorized
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AMENDED

CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY

OF

GWPETROLEUMINC.

The Department of Business Regulation, Division of Corporations and Commercial Code, pursuant

to the ....Ÿ.W...N.E.Ë¶¶Ë.R.EP E.R$ . .... Act, hereby issues an Amended Certif " of Authority to

GW ETULEUM INg. UW ETEOLWM gÇ.

to transact business in the State of Utah.

File No. #79959

DIVISIONOF
OIL.GAS & MINING

Da tedth is . . ..
.... .. ... ............... dayof

Û 4 Director, Division of Corpo ations and
Commercial
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6705-36
Aev. 6-84

Filing Fee: $25.00 File Duplicate Originals

- APPLICATION FOR (sy gg 23 gg 2: 28
AMENDED CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY

OF

. BOW VALLEY PETROLEUM INC.

To the Division of Corporations and Commercial Code
State of Utah

Pursuant to the provisions of Section 16-10-14 of the Utah Business Corporation Act, the
undersigned corporation hereby applies for an Amended Certificate of Authority to transact business
Utah, and for that purpose submits the following statement:

FIRST: A Certificate of Authority was issued to the corporation by your office on

December 19,
, 19 78

, authorizing it to transact business in your State.

SECOND: The corporate name of the corporation has been changed to

GW PETROLEUM INC.

THIRD: The corporation will use the changed name hereafter in Utah.

FOURTH: It desires to pursue in the transaction of businesss in Utah other or additional
purpo3es than those set forth in its prior Application for a Certificate of Authority, as follows:

No change

Dated Fehr ry 3 , 19 SL...

Notes: 1. If the corporate name has not been changed, insert "No Change".

2. If no other or additional purposes are proposed, insert "NO Change".

Under penalties of perjury, we declare that this application for Amended Certificate of
Authority has been exmined by us and is, to the best of our knowledge and belief, true, correct and
complete.

Send completed forms to:
STATE OF UTAH GW PETROLEUM INC.
Department of Business Regulation

(exac corpo te na e)
Div. of Corporations & Commercial Code
160 E. 300 South / P.O. Box 5801
S 4110 - 5801

DIVISl0NOF
OIL GAS & MINING Ass,s .nt
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DOGM Form 5
May 5, 1987

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OtL, GAS, AND MINING 6. t.saan naaronarson ama amara no.

SUNDRY NOTKES AND REPO
(De not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or (6 re••rv r.

Use "APP11CATION FOR PER3tlT-" for e.)

1. y 1. unrr zonssuant xxxx

wat.r. O w..... O 42.-

2. xxxx or orzaatoa 8. rang om z.aAas xxxx

Flying J, Inc. H.D. Landy
8. Inossas or orsmazon 9. war.r. no.

P.O. Box 175 North Salt Lake, Utah 84054 1-30A1E
4. I.ocation or war.r. (Report location hiearly and in accordance with any State requirementa.• 10. rist.n Axo roor., on wit.ncar

See also space 17 below.)
It surface

11, sac, 2, s., x, om aLE. AND
sexy-T om AasA

T. 1S R. 1E Sec. 30
14. APi NUMBER 16. at.xvATraNs (Show whether Dr. RT. GM, sta.) 12, COUNTT OR FAal3E A STATA

43-047-30790 Uintah Utah

to CheckAppropnote BoxTo Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or OtherDate
Worres or INTaxTrox to: somsaqUENT 1570BT 07:

TSET WATIE BRUT•OFT 701.L OR ALTER .CA$lNO WATER SHUT-Orr REPAIRIMO WELL

PRACTUES TREAT MCI.TIPLE COMPt.ETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

3HOOT OE ACIDIES ABANDON* BROUTING OR ACIDizlNO ABANDOMMENT*

arrAix wzt.I. ettANos Pt.aNs (Other; Œange of Operator X

(Other)
(NoTz: Report results of :nultiple completion on Well

.-....
Unmpletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. Dr.scatac rnovosxn on comrLETro GPERATroNs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent datem including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If weil la directionally drilled. sive subsurface locations and messured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-

nous to this work.) *

The above well was taken over by Flying J, Inc. from GW Petroleum, effective

March 15, 1989.

18. I hpreby ce that the to ing is true and correct

SIGNED he L- Technical Assistant pagg October 25, 1989

(This space for raderal or State omce nae)

Arraovmo BT TTTY W DATE
CONDITIONS 07 APPROVAL, IP ANT:

*SeeInstructionson Revers.
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Eorm OCC4b 'A\llT IN TRll'ld \ I'E÷

g STATE OF UTAH Other instruenon on
reverv -nir i

DEPARTi --NT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING L casa oratostion so .c o.

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not use this form for pr osals to dMll or to deepen or pipbr back.to a differtat reservoir.

Use "APP CATION FOR PERMIT-" for ic ropossis.)

1. Î. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

LLL wtaLL
oma

2. Nixa or orzaatos -' 8. ranu on taxas .yaux

GW Petroleum Inc . See Attached
3. Icozzas or orsmazon 9. wsLI. no.

1111 Bagby, Suite 1700 Houston, Texas 77002 See Attached
4. LocaTION or wtLL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10. riaLD AND Poot, on wlLocar

See also space 17 below.)
It surface

See Attached u. ..c.. 2., a.. x.. on a=x. suo
BGEYST OR AAAA

14. PraMIT NO. 15. aavArtoNa (Show whether Dr. xT, an, etc.) UN a katsu 13. sTATE

UtahUint,ah
"· CheckAppropnate BoxTo indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data

NOTICE 07 INT3NTION TO: SU388QURNT REFORT 07:

TIET WITER BRUTar? PULL OR ALTER CASINC WATER SHUT-Orr REPAIRING WELL

TRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE PRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING ClalNo

SHooT on ACIDizz I ABANDON° SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

neata wzt.L cuANor PLANs (Other) Change of Operator
(NOTt: Report results of multiple completion on Well(Other) ('ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. ossentac ruovosED OR cuNrLETED UPERATioNs (Clearly state all pertinent derails. and give pertinent dates. Including eartmated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drided, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depcns for all markers and r.ones perti-
nent to this work.) *

Effective April 1, 1989, Flying J Corporation took over operation of the wells
listed on the following attachment.

PJF

GLH

MICROFILM

FILE

18. I hereby cert that the forego ng is true and correct

SIGNED TITLE ŸTXTl DPATi n DATE 10 /27 /89
(This space for Federal or State ofice use)

A PP" VED BT TITLE DATE
Cu: 1.ux.. 73 OF APPROVAL, IF
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.=L NAME API NUMBER LOCATION WELL NAME API NUMBER LOCATION

UTE TRIBAL12 4301330020 00690 IS 1W 8 KM CARRELLT#.1 4301330158 02307 25 3¾ 27 - CGOSEGOVT11 4304720171 00695 65 21E 19 D. RRONG'229A1E 4304731470 09505 15 1E 19 - C -

GOSTGOVT2-18 4304720062 00697 6S 21E 18 08ERHANSLY¿2-31Z1 4301330970 09725 1N lW 31 "
K. SHISLER #1 4301330041 00700 13 1W 9 O Nj- 4304731480 10135 IN lW 26,- C
UTE TRIBAL 2-358 4301330106 00705 1N 2W 35 PAPADOPULOS2-34A1E 4304730683 10610 15 1E 34 -

E. YUMP#1 4301330167 00710 1N 1W 31 JESSEN 2-14A4 4301331160 10611 13 4W 14 "
UTETRIBAL 1-268 430133 68 0715 1N 2W 26 UTE TRIBAL#2-34Z2 4301331167 10668 IN 2W 34
FARNSWORTH'#1 43013 0 730 15 4W 18 - 6 BASTIAN.#3-8A1 4301331181 10758 15 1N 8
SHINER#11Ì4A 4301330258 00735 15 4W 14- C LILA'D.'f2-25A1 4304731797 10790 15 1N 25BASTIAN'1-2A1 4304731373 00736 15 1W2 --

CARSON 2-36Al 4304731407 00737 15 1W 36
V.5MILES #1 4301330275 00740 15 4W 20 - CA.=RUST~f2

4301330290 00745 1S 4W 22 "
REARY1-X17A3 4301330326 00750 1S 3W _17-ELL
UTE TRIBAL 1-32Zl 4301330324 00755 1N 1W 32
GOYT4-14 4304730155 00760 65 20E 14
SADIE BLANK 1-33ZI 4301330355 00765 IN 1W 33 - C
UTETRIBAL 1-348 4301310494 00775 1N 2W 34
UTE TRIBAL1-16 4304730231 00780 15 1E 16
PAPADOPULOS1-34A1E 4304730241 00785 IS 1E 34-¶(
C.*J ÄCKFORD 1223 4304730279 00790 15 1E 23 .- (U
UTETRIBAL 1-35A1E 4304730286 00795 15 1E 35
UTETRIBAL 1-17AlE 4304730421 00800 15 1E 27

AYIS 1-33 4304730384 00805 15 1E 33-
UTETRIBAL 1-22A1E 4304730429 00810 15 1E 22
LARSEN 1-25Al 4304730552 00815 .1S IW 25-g€
DRY GULCH 1-36A1 4304730569 00820 15 1N 36-Ñt
NELSON 1-31AIE 4304730671 00830 1S 1E 31--Ëd-

NJTE TRIBAL1-32A1E 4304730676 00835 15 1E 32
OSEMARYLLOYD 1-24A1E 4304730707 00840 15 1E 24 --ËCC

H. O. LANDY I-30A1E 4304730790 00845 15 1E 30 ••ÊC
UTE TRIBAL1-15AlE 4304730820 0085 15 1E 15
WALKER1-14AlE 43047308 0 85'5 13 1E 14 -RC
UTETRIBAL 1-17A1E 4304730829 00860 15 1E 17
UTETRIBAL 1-25AlE 4304730830 00865 15 lE 25
FAUSETT1-26AIE 4304730821 00870 15 1E 26-
HOUSTON1-34Zl 4301330566 00885 1N IW 34•
E. FISHER #2-26A4 4301331119 00890 IS 4W 26
UTETRIBAL 1-29AlE 4304730937 00895 15 1E 29
80LTON 2-29AlE 4304731112 00900 1S 1E 29
WISSE 1-28Z1 4301330609 00905 1N IW 28-
POWELL1-2ÌBI 4301330621 00910 25 1N 21, C

TE TRIBAL2-22A1E 4304731265 00915 15 1E 22 -

L.- BOLTON 1-12A1 4304731295 00920 15 1W 12 -

H. MARTIN 1-21Z1 4301330707 00925 1N 1W 21 -

FOWLES1-26Al 4304731296 00930 15 1W 26
LAWSON1-21A1 4301330738 00935 15 IW 21 -(¿E

R. HOUSTON 1-22Z1 4301330884 00936 IN 1W 22 - ÑC
BIRCHELL 1-27Al 4301330758 00940 15 1W 27-Ñ
WESLEY BASTIAN FEE #1 4301310496 00942 IS IW 8 -fŒ

KNIGHT #1 4301330184 01090 2S 3W 28 -K€
MYRIN RANCH#1 4301330176 01091 2S 3W 20 -fd

DUSTIN #1 4301330122 01092 25 3W 22
HANS£N #1 4301330161 01093 2S 3W 23
PRESCOTT'lI35Zl' 4304731173 01425 1N 1N



State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

Norman H. Bangerter
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

Governor

Dee C. Hansen
355 West North Temple

Executive Director 3 Triad Center, Suite 350

Dianne R. Nielson, Ph.D. Salt Lake City.Utah 84180-1203

DivisionDirector 801-538-5340

December 14, 1989

GW Petroleum Inc.
1111 Bagby
Suite 1700
Houston, Texas 77002

Gentlemen:

Re: Notification of Lease Sale or Transfer

The division recently received notification of a change of operator from GW Petroleum Inc. to
Flying J Corporation for the followingwells located on fee leases:

Farnsworth #1 / API No. 43-013-30209
Shiner #1-14A4 API No. 43-013-30258

Bastian 1-2A1 API No. 43-047-31373
V. Miles #1 / API No. 43-013-30275
A. Rust #2 / 6 API No. 43-013-30290

Reary 1-X17A3 API No. 43-013-30326

Sadie Blank 1-33Z1 API No. 43-013-30355
Papadopulos 1-34A1E API No. 43-047-30241
C.J. Hackford 1-23 / 5 76 API No. 43-047-30279
Davis 1-33 i s /E API No. 43-047-30384
Larsen 1-25A1 API No. 43-047-30552
Dry Gulch 1-36A1 API No. 43-047-30569
Nelson 1-31A1E API No. 43-047-30671
Rosemary Lloyd 1-24A1E API No. 43-047-30707
H.D. Landy 1-30A1E API No. 43-047-30790
Walker 1-14A1E API No. 43-047-30805
Fausett 1-26A1E AP1 No. 43-047-30821

Houston 1-34Z1 API No. 43-013-30566
E. Fisher #2-26A4 API No. 43-013-31119
Boulton 2-29A1E API No. 43-047-31112
Wisse 1-28Z1 API No. 43-013-30609
Powell 1-21 B1 API No. 43-013-30621
Ute Tribal 2-22A1E API No. 43-047-31265
L. Bolton 1-12A1 APINo. 43-047-31295
H. Martin 1-21Z1 API No. 43-013-30707

an equal opportunity



Page 2
GW Petroleum Inc.
December 14, 1989

H. Martin 1-21Z1 API No. 43-013-30707
Fowles 1-26A1 API No. 43-047-31296
Lawson 1-21A1 API No. 43-013-30738
R. Houston 1-22Z1 API No. 43-013-30884

Birchell 1-27A1 API No. 43-013-30758
Wesley Bastian Fee #1 AP1No. 43-013-10496
Knight #1 API No. 43-013-30184

Myrin Ranch #1 API No. 43-013-30176
Dustin #1 API No. 43-013-30122
Hansen #1 6 API No. 43-013-30161

Prescott 1-35Z1 API No. 43-047-31173

KW Carrell #1 .

* API No. 43-013-30158

D. R. Long 2-19A1E API No. 43-047-31470

Oberhansly 2-31Z1 API No. 43-013-30970

O Moon 2-26Z1 API No. 43-047-31480

Papadopulos 2-34A1E API No. 43-047-30683

Jessen 2-14A4 API No. 43-013-31160
Bastian #3-8A1 API No. 43-013-31181
Lila D. #2-25A1 API No. 43-047-31797

Rule R615-2-10, of the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules, states:

"The owner of a lease shall provide notification to any person with an
interest in such lease, when all or part of that interest in the lease is sold
or transferred."

This letter is written to advise GW Petroleum Inc. of its responsibilityto notifyall individuals with
an interest in these leases of the change of operator. Please provide written documentation
of this notification to the division no later than January 15, 1990.

Sincerely,

Don Staley
Administrative Supervisor
Oil and Gas

Idc
cc: D.R. Nielson

R.J. Firth
Well files



FLYING J INC.
333 WEST CENTER - NORTH SALT LAKE,UTAH 84054

(801) 298-7733

December 19, 1989

Mr. Don Staley
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, UT 84180

RE: GW Petroleum Sale of Properties to Flying J
Bluebell/Altamont Fields
Duchesne, Uintah Counties, UT

Dear Mr. Staley:

Norman Zeiler of GW Petroleum informed me today that he had received
a letter from the Division or Oil, Gas 6eMining indicating that per
Utah statute, owners under the properties which they sold to Flying J
needed to be informed of the sale. Please be advised that Flying J
has sent new division orders to all royalty, overriding royalty and working
interest owners based on the pay sheets we received from GW Petroleum.
With the new division orders we enclosed a letter stating that Flying
J had purchased these properties from GW Petroleum. That would cover
all the owners in FJ operated properties for whom we had correct
addresses. We have also contacted the operators for non-operated wells
in order to have the revenue stream converted to FJ. The assignment
showing all leases we purchased has been recorded in both Uintah and
Duchesne counties. We are in the process of having non-operators
under communitized locations sign designations of operator naming Flying
J the new operator.

Please advise if this does not constitute notice under Utah law.
If it does not, please let me know as soon as possible what additional
steps need to be taken to comply.

Yours agy truly,

LaVonn J. Garrison-Stringer
Land Manager

cc: Mr. Norman



ELL NAME API NUMBER LOCATION WELL NAME API NUMBER LOCATION

GOSEGOVT#1 4304720171 00695 6S 21E 19 D. R. LONG 2-19AIE 4304731470 09505 15 1E 19

GOSTGOVT2-18 4304720062 00697 6S 21E 18 0BERHANSLY2-31Z1 4301330970 09725 1N 1W31

K. SHISLER#1 4301330041 00700 15 1W 9 \·0 MOON2-26Z1 4304731480 10135 1N 1W 26

UTETRIBAL2-358 4301330106 00705 1N 2W 35 N PAPADOPULOS2-34AlE 4304730683 10610 15 1E 34

E. YUMP#1 4301330167 00710 1N lW 31 X:JESSEN 2-14A4 4301331160 10611 IS 4W 14

UTETRIBAL 1-268 430133 68 0715 1N 2W 26 UTE TRIBAL#2-34Z2 4301331167 10668 1N 2W 34

FARNSWORTH#1 4301330tS9 00730 13 4W 18 - Š$ BASTIAN #3-8A1 4301331181 10758 15 1W8

SHINER #1-14A4 4301330258 00735 15 4W 14- C LILA D. #2-25A1 4304731797 10790 1S 1W 25

BASTIAN1-2A1 4304731373 00736 15 lW 2 -- fet
CARSON 2-36A1 4304731407 00737 15 1W 36

V. MILES#1 4301330275 00740 15 4W 20 - (fC

A. RUST#2 4301330290 00745 1S 4W 22 '
...

REARY 1-X17A3
.

4301330326 00750 1S 3W 17-Et-C

UTE TRIBAL1-32Z1 4301330324 00755 IN 1M 32 € &

D
E48

K 1-33Z1
7300 314

UTETRIBAL 1-348 4301310494 00775 IN 2W 34

UTETRIBAL1-16 4304730231 00780 15 1E 16

PAPADOPULOS1-34AIE 4304730241 00785 15 1E 34•-(CC

C. J. HACKFORD1-23 4304730279 00790 1S 1E 23 - ý¿C

UTETRIBAL1-35A1E 4304730286 00795 1S 1E 35

UTETRIBAL1-17A1E 4304730421 00800 13 1E 27

AVIS 1-33 4304730384 00805 13 1E 33- Ç-6
UTETRIBAL 1-22A1E 4304730429 00810 15 1E 22

LARSEN 1-25A1 4304730552 00815 1S 1W 25 -gd

DRY GULCH 1-36A1 4304730569 00820 1S 1W 36-ÑL

NELSON 1-31A1E 4304730671 00830 1S 1E 31-Ë<t
NTE TRIBAL1-32A1E 4304730676 00835 15 1E 32

OSEMARYLLOYD1-24AIE 4304730707 00840 15 1E 24•-ËCC

H. D. LANDY1-30AlE 4304730790 00845 13 1E 3 *N
UTETRIBAL 1-15AIE 4304730820 0085 15 1E 15

WALKER1-14A1E 43047308 0
815'5

1S 1E 14 -FCC

UTETRIBAL1-17A1E 4304730829 00860 15 1E 17

UTETRIBAL1-25A1E 4304730830 00865 1S 1E 25

FAUSETT 1-26A1E 43Õ473082100870 15 1E 26-9

HOUSTON1-34Z1 4301330566 00885 1N 1W34• †
E. FISHER #2-26A4 4301331119 00890 1S 4W 26 Á
UTETRIBAL1-29A1E 4304730937 00895 15 1E 29

80LTON 2-29A1E 4304731112 00900 15 1E 29•

ISSE 1-28Z1 4301330609 00905 1N 1W 28-

NPOWELL1-2181 4301330621 00910 2S 1W 21 --À
NTE TRIBAL2-22AlE 4304731265 00915 15 1E 22 -f

N L. BOLTON 1-12A1 4304731295 00920 15 1W 12 -

H. MARTIN 1-21Z1 4301330707 00925 1N 1W 21 -

FOWLES 1-26A1 - 4304731296 00930 1S 1W 26

LAWSON1-21A1 4301330738 00935 1S IN 21

R. HOUSTON 1-22Z1 4301330884 00936 1N lW 22 - RL

81RCHELL1-27A1 4301330758 00940 15 1W 27 -Ñ
WESLEYBASTIAN FEE #1 4301310496 00942 15 1W 8 -- ý(€
KNIGHT#1 4301330184 01090 2S 3¾ 28 -ft€

MYRINRANCH#1 4301330176 01091 2S 3W 20 -fd

DUSTIN #1 4301330122 01092 2S 3W 22 -

HANSEN #1 4301330161 01093 2S 3W 23 ' L

NPRESCOTT 1-35Z1 4304731173 01425 1N 1W35 -



/ '

rm OGCC-l b.
STATE OF UTAH 8tBMIT IN TRIPLICATE'

(Other Instructions on re .

Verse side) 6. LEAas DEstanarzoN AND azalAL 50.

OlL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

SUNDRYNOTKES AND REPORTSON WELLS
" ' "'°

(Do not use this foran for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
U.« ••APPLICATION FOR PERMIT---" for eb ropeenla

7. UNIT AGEEEMENT MAME

wrL exsLL
oTuss

. NAME Or OPathTom 8. FAxios LR4-E NAME

Flying J Inc AUG06 990
A. ADDREBB OF OFREATOR

9. WELL NO.

PO Drawer 130 Roosevelt, Utah 84066 D'
4. LOCAT30N OP WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance withiany State requirenients.• 10. rison ANo root, on wlLDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
At surface

11. sac., T., a., M., 05 BLE. AND
SURT3T 05 ABEA

14. Fazult No. 15. stavArtoNs (Show whether er, at, on, etc.) 12. couxtT on Phalax 18. BTATE

16' OCÑApprognait SOx To Indicate Natureof Notice,Report,or OtherData
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUmsmQU3NT REPORT 07:

TEST WATER BEUTorr PULL OR ALTER CAalNG WATER BHUT•Orr REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CAglNG

SHOOT OR ACIDizz ABANDON* SHOUTING OR ACIDIEING ABANDONNENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLAnn (Other)

Flare sii X mo====•»ort ==lt••* ==lti I•••= 1 = •= Vel
(Other) ('umpletion or Recompletion Report and Lot form.)

17. DESCRIBE rnnPOSF.D OR CUM1'LETT.D OPERATIONs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-

nent to this stork.) *

In reference to the two telephone conversations between Jim Hooks of Flying J Inc. Ron Firth
of the Division of Oil, Gas & 11tning, and Ed Forsman of the Bureau of Land Management'; on
Jul y 27, 1990, concerning the explosion and subsequent closure of the Gary Refining Inc. Gas
Plant located in Cederview. Notification is submitted of our intent to flare cas on the wells
listed below from the evening of July 21, 1990, (the time of the explosion) to when Gary
Refining Inc. is back in operation. Possibly as late as Aucust 31, 1990' Aoproximately 39%
of the gas production on the wells listed well be used as lease fuel.

WELLNAME SECTIE TOWNSHIPRANSECOUNTY API i WELLNAME SECTIONTOWNH3 RANGECOUNTYAPI #

ÑBASTIAN3-8A1 8 IS 1W D 013-31181 MP1-3441E 34 18 lE U 047-30241
BIRCHELL1-27Ai . 27 15 1W D 013-30758 H MARTIN1-2121 21 IN 1W D 013-3070¯
BOLTON2-29AlE 29 15 1E U 047-31112 0 MOON2-2621 26 1N iW U 047-31480
L BOLTON1-12Ai 12 IS 1W 'J 047-31295 PWELL1-2181 21 25 lW L 013-30621
UTECARSON2-36Ai 36 12 1W U 047-31407 TENNECD 19 28 IE U 047-31004
DRï BULCH1-36Ai 36 15 IW U 047-3û569 DIE1-15AIE 15 is lE U û47-30820
FOWLES1-26A1 26 is 1W U 047-31296 UTE1-29A I-2221 29 15 1E D 047-30937
HOUSTON1-34Zl 34 IN 1W D 013-30566 UTE1-32Ïl 32 IN 1W D 013-30324
R HOUSTON1-22Zl 22 1N 1W D 013-30834 UTE2-22AIE 22 15 1E U 047-31255
HDLANDY1-30AIE 30 15 1E U 047-30790 UTE2-3422 34 IN 2W D 013-31167
LILAD 25 15 1W U 047-31797

18. I hpreby certify at the f egoinf is true nd correct

BIGNE /A / f
' TITLE Field Superintendent DATE 8/2/90

(This space for Federal or State once use) APPRÖVEÕŠŸTHE STATE
APPROVED BY TITLE T A I OF
CONDITIONS OF APPROVIL, IF ANY :

t Înstructionson



Fo;m o SI E OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES 6. Lease Designation and Serial Number

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS ANDMINING
7. Indian Allottee or Trfbe Name

SUNDRY NOTICESANDREPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use Itpleform for proposals to drin rtew wel!¾deepen exisdagwolle,or toreenter pîngged andabandoned wolle. 8. Unit or Communitization Agreement

useAPPLICATIONFOR PERMIT-for auch ptoposals

1. Type of Well 9. Well Name and Number
°w¾,, O g, O on..rt.p.c'M Landy 1-30A1E

2. Name of Operator 10. API Well Number

Fl yino J Oil and Gas 43 047 30790
3. Address of Operator 4. Telephone Number 11. Field and Pool, or Wildcat

PO Drawer 130 Roosevelt, Utah 84066 722-5166 Bluebell
5. Location of Well

Footage : 1525' FNL 2037' FWL SE/NW County : Uintah
oo.s.o.T..n..u.: Sec 30 T1S R1E USM State : UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOXESTO INDICATENt TURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

O Abandonment O New Construction O Abandonment ° O New Construction
O casingRepair OP " or ^tter casin O casingRepair O Pun or ^tter casing
O Change of Plans O Recompletion O Change of Plans g Shoot or Acidize

O conversionto injection O Shoot or^cidize O conversionto injection O ventor Flare

O Fracture Treat O Vent or Flare O Fracture Treat O Water Shut-OH

O Multiple Completion O Water Shut-O" O Other

O Oth•r
Date ofWork Completion 6/2/92

Approximate Date Work Will Start
Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompledons to diflerent reservoirs
on WELLCOMPLETIONOR RECOMPLETioN ANDLOG form.
* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

13. DESCRIBEPROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS(Clearly state all pertinent detalla, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell is directionally drilled, give subeurface
locatione and measured and true vertical depthe for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

SEE ATTACHMENT

QUL0 1 1992

DMSIONOF

that the foregoing is true and correct
PRODUCTION

Name&Signature J. KREGHILL .,. SUPERINTENDENT oate 6/26/92
(State Use Only)

(8/90) See instructione on Reverse



H.D. LANDY 1-3OA1E
ATTACHMENT
PAGE 1

5-6-92 THROUGH 6/2-92

C/O WELLBORE TO 12,883'. ACIDIZE WASATCH PERFS
11,504' TO 12,900°. LOWER PROD STRING 914'.

CHANGE OUT LUFKIN 640 PUMPING UNIT W/LUFKIN 912 PUMPING UNIT.

5/6/92: MIRUSU. TOOH W/ROD PUMP.

5/7/92: TOOH W/7" AC & BHA. TAG FILL @12,749' W/2" OD
BLIND BOX.

5/8-9/92: RECOVER APPROXIMATELY 3000' .092 SLICKLINE WIRE
W/PMT.

5/10/92: MILL & REC BAKER #32FAB30 PKR SET ON W/L
11/13/80 @10,092'.

5/12-
22-92: FISH, RECOVER ADDITIONAL 2600' OF .092

SLICKLINE WIRE & 120' OF 9/16" SWAB LINE
W/COMPLETE SET OF TOOLS W/WIRE ROPE SPEARS.
FINAL RUN, ROTATE C/O F/12,877' TO 12,883'
W/3 7/8" OD CLULOW SOCKET, REC ESTIMATED 75'-

.092 SLICKLINE WIRE BALLED UP IN BTM 2' OF
CLULOW SOCKET. NOTE: SHOWED TO BE ROTATING ON
TOP OF SLICKLINE ROPE SOCKET FISH, SLIGHTLY OFF
CENTER, @12,883'. NOTE: POSSIBLE 2 SETS OF
SLICKLINE TOOLS LEFT IN HOLE W/PIECES OF
SLICKLINE WIRE ON SAME @12,883'.

5/23/92: SET BAKER 5" 18# R-3 DBL GRIP RET CSG PKR
@10,132' IN 20,000# COMPRESSION. HYDRO TEST
TBG TO 9500#. TEST ANNULUS TO 3000#.

5/27/92: ACIDIZE WASATCH INTERVALS 11,504' TO 12,900',
54 INTV, 150', 300 PERFS. C/O DEPTH 12,883',
TOP OF SLICKLINE TOOLS, FISH. BTM PERFS
12,897'-900', 3', 6 PERFS. PUMP 20,000 GAL
15/. HCL CONTAINING 6/1000 GAL CORROSION
INHIBITOR, 10/1000 GAL IRON CONTROL, 2/1000
GAL NON EMULSIFIER, 10/1000 GAL JETCO KOTE 598
SCALE INHIBITOR & 1/1000 GAL FRICTION REDUCER.
DIVERT W/600, 1.3 RCN BALL SEALERS & 3000# BA



H.D. LANDY 1-3OA1E
ATTACHMENT
PAGE 2

5/28-29/92: SWAB TEST.

5/29-30/92: PULL PKR SET @10,132'.

5/30/92: SET 7" AC BTM @9950.44'. NU TREE.

5/30/92: RUN 2 1/2" X 1 3/4" X 20' X 24'
HARBISDN FISHER 2-STAGE RHBC ROD
PUMP W/21' LG 1 1/4" ID LP W/1' LG
SCREEN WELDED TO SAME. SEAT
@9950.44' TOP OF SN. PRODUCE WELL TO
TREATER.

6/2/92:



Form e STAT JF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF ..ATURAL RESOURCES .

e. Lease oesignationand Serial Number

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
7. Indian Allottee or Tribe Name

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use thie forut for proposals to drHInewswolle, deepen existingselle. or to teenter pîngged and abandoned welle. 8. Unit or Communitization Agreement

Use APPt.!CAT10N FOR PEiWIIT-for such ptoposals

1. Type of Well 9. Well Name and Number

L, O g, O °*"(***°i Landy 1-30A1E
2. Name of Operator 10. API Well Number

Flyino J Oil and Gas 43 047 30790
3. Address of Operator 4. TelephoneNumber 11. Field and Pool, or Wildcat

PO Drawer 130 Roosevelt, Utah 84066 722-5166 Bluebell
5. Location of Weil

Footao• : 1525' FNL 2037' FNL SE/NW county: Uintah
OO, Soc. T., R., M. : Sec 30 T1S R1E USM State : UTAH

m. ÓNECK APORÓRRIATEBÓ¾Eh TÓINDIÒATENAft|BEDE NÓTlÒEMBEPORTLÓRiÓTHERDATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(submitin Duplicate) (submitoriginalForm only)

O Abandonment O New Construction O Abandonment ° O New Construction

O casingnepair O Pun o'^ner casi"o O casingRepair O Pun o'^iter casing
O cnanceet Plans O necoml•tlo" O Change of Plans g Shoot or Acidize

O conversionto injection O Shoot o'^cidize O conversionto injection O ventor Fiare

O Fracture Treat O ventor Fiar• O Fracture Treat O watersnut-on

O Mumple Completion O Water Shut-OH er

O ©t •r
e ofWork Completion 6/2/92

Approximate Date Work Will Start
Report results of Muldple Completions and Recomplodons to different resenpoirs
on WELLCOMPLET10N OR AECOMPLETIONANDLOG Iorm.

Must be accompanied by a cement verißcadon report.

13. DESCRISE PROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give perdnent dates. Ifwell is direadonally drilled, give subaurface
locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

SEE ATTACHMENT

0CT0 6 1992

DMSION0.9
f)!! GAR R. thNIAlf

¼. I hereby certuy that the foregoing is true and correct PRODUCTION
Name&Signature Û/ t : J. KREGHILL SUPERINTENDENT oat. 6/26/92

(statou..only)

(SISO) See Instructions on Reverse





H.D. LANDY 1-3OA1E
ATTACHMENT
PAGE 2

·¯ 5/28-29/92: SWAB TEST.

5/29-30/92: PULL PKR SET @10,132'.

5/30/92: SET 7" AC BTM @9950.44°. NU TREE.

5/30/92: RUN 2 1/2" X 1 3/4" X 20' X 24'
HARBISON FISHER 2-STAGE RHBC ROD
PUMP W/21° LG 1 1/4" ID LP W/1' LG
SCREEN WELDED TO SAME. SEAT
@9950.44' TOP OF SN. PRODUCE WELL TO
TREATER.

6/2/92:



Form o STA' F UTAH
OEPAATMENT OE . ÂTURAL AESOURCES 6. Lease Designauon anC Senat Number
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING Fe,

7. indian Allottee•3r Inde N;tmn

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
ce r o ter a

. umtor communmzanonAgreemS

1. I pe of Wesi
9. Well Name ana .Numeerouter specy

I Landy 1-30A1E
2.NameatOperator 10. API Weil Numaer

Flying J Óil & Gas Inc.
.43-047-30.790

2. Address of Operator -- - - --- ---

Numoet 11. Fieid and Poot, or Wildcat
P.O. Box 540180 North Salt Lake, UT 84054GLBÔAc 8-7733 Bluebell

5. Locacian at Weit

.=ootage : 1525' FNL, 2037' FWL county: Uintah
QQ. Sec. T., R., M. : GCC. 3c T 11 OE

State : UTAH
:?.4; CHECK AREROPRIA.TEBOXES TO INDICATENATUREOENOILGELRE.9QRT OR OTHE.RDATA

NOTICEOF INTENT SUSSEQUENT RE ORT(Submit in Ouplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)
Abandonment O New Construction O Abandonment • Q New Construction

0 casingnepair OF '^ttar casina O casingsemair OP ll or^trer casing
ChangeofPtans O secompletto O cuane•°i"'=3 O Shooter^cietz.

O conversionto injection O snootor Acterze O conversionto injectio O ventor stare
Fracture Treat O ventor star• O Fracture Treat O watersaut-on
Multiple Completfon O watersnut-of O 6t"•'
Ottler Clean tip pit & instàll tank

Date of Woric Completion
Approximate Date Woric WIIIStart

Report resuits of Multiple Comoledons and Recompledone to different reservoirs .

onWELLCOMPLETION OR AECCMPt.5TION ANDt.OG torm.
- * Must be accompanied by a cementverificadon reoort.

ta.DESCRISE PACPOSED CA COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearty state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell is direedonally drilled. give subsurfacelocations and measured and true vertical depths for all maricers and zones perdnent to this worg.)

Flying J requests approval to close the existing emergency pit at the referenced
location and install an above ground tank for containment of fluids. The tank will
receive produced fluids only in emergency situation involving upsets at the well's
production facilities and fluids in the tank will be removed & properly disposed in
a timely manner. The existing pit will be cleaned up by treating and separating as
much fluid as ossible through the production facility and by using newly developed
bioremediati composting techniques on any remaining hydrocarbons.

APPROVED BY T
OF UTAH DIVISi

. OIL, GAS, AND MINING
DATE: 77--f V

14. I hereby ceruty tn e to going is tru na corre

Name&Signature '
· A .Toliti R ßiy/FI ' T- Petroleiim Rnyinappate 11/16/97(State Use Cnty)

(8/90) See Instructions on Aeverse



FLYING J OIL & GAS INC.
\ 333 WEST CENTER STREET • PO. BOX 540180 • NORTH SALT LAKE,UTAH 84054-0180

PHONE (801) 298-7733• FAX(801) 298-9394

March 8, 1995

Ms. Diane Mitchell
Bureau of Indian Affairs
P. O. Box 130
Fort Duchesne, Utah 84026

Re: State of Utah
Communitization Agreements
Duchesne and Uintah Counties

Dear Diane:

Enclosed, herewith is a recorded copies of the following list
documents in order for you to approve all of the Communitization
Agreements from Flying J Inc. and Flying J Exploration & Production
Inc. into Flying J Oil & Gas Inc:

1. Affidavit with Articles of Merger of Flying J
Uintah Inc with and into Flying J Oil & Gas
Inc.

2. Assignment from Flying J Inc. into Flying J
Uintah Inc.

3. Assignment from Flying J Uintah Inc. into Flying J Inc.

4. Assignment from Flying J Inc. and Flying J
Exploration and Production Inc. into Flying J
Uintah Inc.

Attached is a list of the Communitization Agreements that are still
in the name of Flying J Inc. and Flying J Exploration and
Production Inc.

Should you need any additional information, please contact the
undersigned.

Sincerely,

FLYING J OIL & GAS INC.

Coralie Timothy
Lease Records Administrator

cc: Ms heresa Thompson, Bureau of Land Management, Salt Lake
s. Lisha Cordova, State of Utah, Oil, Gas and



COMMUNITIZATION AGREEMENTS
STATE OF UTAH

March 8, 1995

Listed below are the Communitization Agreements to be changed into
the name of Flying J Oil & Gas Inc.:

Comm Agreement No. Operator

UTOBOI49-85C680 Flying J Inc.
UTO80I49-85C705 Flying J Inc.
UTO80I49-84C713 Flying J Inc.
9C-000122 Flying J Inc.
9C-000144 Flying J Inc.
VR49I-84683C Flying J Inc.
UTO80I49-86C681 Flying J Explor. & Prod.
VR49I-84689C Flying J Inc.
9C-000171 Flying J Explor. & Prod.
9C-000175 Flying J Inc.
UTO80I49-84C712 Flying J Inc.
CR-I-157 Flying J Inc.
9C-000176 Flying J Inc.
9C-000149 Flying J Inc.
9C-000173 Flying J Inc.96-000111 Flying J Explor. & Prod.
VR49I-84670C Flying J Inc.
VR49I-84671C Flying J Inc.
VR49I-84673C Flying J Inc.
VR49I-84677C Flying J Inc.
NRM-696 Flying J Inc.96-000115 Flying J Explor. & Prod.CR-I-156 Flying J Inc.
UTOBOI49-85C680 Flying J Inc.
UTO80I49-85C705 Flying J Inc.
UTO80I49-84C713 Flying J Inc.9C-000122 Flying J Inc.90-000144 Flying J Inc.
VR49I-84683C Flying J Inc.
UTO80I49-86C681 Flying J Explor. & Prod.VR49I-84689C Flying J Inc.SC-000171 Flying J Explor. &,Prod.9C-000175 Flying J Inc.
UTO80I49-84C712 Flying J Inc.CR-I-157 Flying J Inc.9C-000176 Flying J Inc.9C-000149 Flying J Inc.9C-000173 Flying J Inc.96-000111 Flying J Explor. & Prod.VR49I-84670C Flying J Inc.VR49I-84671C Flying J Inc.VR49I-84673C Flying J Inc.VR49I-84677C Flying J Inc.NRM-696 Flying J



Page 2
March 8, 1995

96-000115 Flying J Explor. & Prod.CR-I-156 Flying J Inc.NW-616 Flying J Explor. &



A FF I D A V I T

STATE OF UTAH )

County of Davis ) Boor.556 PAGE: 2 17
I, LaVonne J. Garrison-Stringer, of lawful age, and being first

duly sworn, upon my oath, deposes and says:

1. That I am the Land Manager for Flying J Oil & Gas Inc. and am
duly authorized to make this Affidavit on behalf of the corporation.

2. That attached hereto and by this reference made a part hereof
is a certified copy of the Articles of Merger of Flying J Uintah Inc.
with and into Flying J Oil & Gas Inc. dated effective Jaunary 2, 1991.

3. That Flying J Oil & Gas Inc. has interests in the following
described sections located in Duchesne and/or Uintah Counties, Utah.

Township 1 North, Range 1 West, USM
Sections 20, 21, 22, 23, 26, 27, 28, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35

Township 1 North, Range 2 West, USM
Sections 26, 31, 34, 35

Township 1 South, Range 1 East, USM
Sections 10, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 29,

30, 31,73?, 33, 34, 35

Township 1 South, Range 1 Westa USM
Sections 2, 4, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 21, 22, 23,

25, 26, 27, 28, 29 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36

Township 1 South, Range 2 East, USM
Section 30

Township 1 South, Range 2 West, USM
pg Sections 1, 2, 3, 5, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 20,

:0 0 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 28, 29, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36

Township i South, Range 3 West, USM
sections 5, 8, 9, 10, 15, 16, 17, 20, 21, 29, 30, 32, 33

Township 1 South, Range 4 West, USM
4 Sections 13, 14, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 24, 26, 27, 28, 29 30, 33, 35

Township .1 South, Range 5 West, USM Ela,ax-r:r 9>3CIEi4 99'E¯
Sections 24, 25, 35 UGS

3
ŸAGE 2ÍŸ AÛ

ftfil1[>'( E>IritiCJFASTownship 2 South, Range 1 East, USM RECORDER,UINTANCOUNTYrUTAN
Sections 2, 5, 6, 7, 10, 18, 19 FLYINGJ DIL ANDGAS

P 0 BOX540180 ND SLC UT 84054-0180
Reo BY: BRENDAncDUNALD r DEPUTYTownship 2 South, Range i West, USM

Sections 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 15, 16, 17, 18, 20, 21

Township 2 South, Range 2 West, USM
Sections 2, 3, 4, 5, 7, 8, 10, 11, 14, 17, 18, 19, 23, 24

Township 2 South, Range 3 West, USM
Sections 2, 4, 5, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 14, 16, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24,

26, 27, 28

Township 3 South, Range 5 West, USM
Sections 14, 15, 16, 26

Township 6 South, Range 20 East, USM
Sections 14

Township 6 South, Range 21 East, USM
Sections 6, 18,
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II. That said merger affects Flying J's interest in the sections
capt.ioned above and any other lands previously owned by Flying J Uintah
Inc. located in Duchesne and/or Uintah Counties, Utah, which are not
described herein.

Further Affiant sayeth not.

LAVONNE J. GARRISON-STRINGER

Subscribed and sworn to before me this 20th day of March 1991.

My Commission Exp.ires: Notary Public for the Stat"e of Utah
Residing at Salt Lake CiËy,Utah

COAAU TIMOllY $
3291Sou 4440West jWestValley Utaf: 84120
MyCommís'slon Ex res Î

Se mber 3



/ ARTICLES OF MERGER// OF
FLYING J UINTAH INC.

WITH AND INTO
----

FLYING J OIL & GAS INC.

THESE ARTICLES OF MERGER (the "Articles") are filed pursuant

to Section 69 of the Utah Business Corporation Act by Flying J

Uintah Inc., a Utah corporation ("Flying J Uintah"), and Flying J

Oil & Gas Inc., a Utah corporation ("Oil & Gas").

Flying J Uintah and Oil & Gas hereby certify as follows:

1. The Boards of Directors of Flying J Uintah and Oil &

:Gas have approved a Plan of Merger relating to the merger of

Flying J Uintah with and into Oil & Gas, with Oil & Gas being the

surviving corporation. A copy of this Plan of Merger, in the

form so approved, is attached to these Articles as Exhibit A.

2. Flying J Uintah has 1,000 shares of Common Stock

outstanding, and Oil & Gas has 3,000,000 shares of Common Stock

outstanding.

3. All outstanding shares of Flying J Uintah and of Oil &

Gas were voted for the Plan of Merger.

Oil & Gas, as the surviving corporation, herebv recuests

that the Utah Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations

and Commercial Code: (i) endorse on the original and one copy of

these Articles the word "filed" and the month, day and year of

the filing; (ii) file the original in its office; and (iii) issue

a Certificate of Merger, together with an attached copy of the

Articles of Merger, to Oil & Gas's representative: P. Christian

Anderson, Esq., Rogers, Mackey, Price, Anderson & Cannon, 900

ITRYNO. DATE TIME SCOK PAGE
FEE$ RECORDEDAT REQUESTOF

DUCHESNECOUNTYRECORDER



First Interstate Plaza, 170 South Main Street, Salt Lake City,

Utah 84101.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, Flying J Uintah and Oil & Gas have

caused these Articles of Merger to be executed effective as of

the 2nd day of January , 199 by their duly authorized officers.

The undersigned declare, under penalty of perjury, that the

matters set forth above are true.

FLYING J UINTAH INC.

J../9hillig A ams,
President

By:
Barre G. rgon,
Secreta

FLYING J OIL & GAS INC.

J<'Phillìþ Adams,
President

Barre G. rgon/
Secreta

017A.fat .g

-2 -



AGREEMENT AND PLAN OF MERGER

OF FLYING J UINTAH INC.

AND FLYING J OIL & GAS INC.

THIS AGREEMENT AND PLAN OF MERGER, dated as of December 1,

1990 (the "Agreement") is entered into by and between Flying J

Uintah Inc., a Utah corporation ("Flying J Uintah"), and Flying J

Oil & Gas Inc., a Utah corporation ("Oil & Gas"). Uintah and Oil

& Gas are sometimes referred to herein as the "Constituent

Corporations."

RECITALS

A. Flying J Uintah is a corporation duly organized and

existing under the laws of the State of Utah and has an

authorized capital of 1,000 shares of Common Stock, having a par

value of $1.00 per share. All 1,000 authorized shares of Flying

J Uintah's Common Stock (the "Flying J Uintah Shares") are issued

and outstanding. No options, warrants, or other rights or

securities exercisable for or convertible into Common Stock of

Flying J Uintah have been issued or are outstanding.

B. Oil & Gas is a corporation duly organized and existing

under the laws of the State of Utah and has an authorized capital

of 10,000,000 shares of Common Stock, $1.00 par value per share,

and 2,000,000 shares of Preferred Stock, $1.00 par value per

share. Oil & Gas has issued and outstanding 3,000,000 shares of

Common Stock (the "Oil & Gas Shares") and no shares of Preferred



C. All of the Flying J Uintah Shares and the Oil & Gas Shares

are held by Big West Oil Company, a Delaware corporation

("Parent"), so that both Oil & Gas and Flying J Uintah are wholly

owned subsidiaries of Parent.

D. Parent and the respective Boards of Directors of Flying J

Uintah and Oil & Gas have determined that, for the purpose of

consolidating oil and gas properties and operations, it is

advisable that Flying J Uintah merge with and into Oil & Gas,

with Oil & Gas to be the surviving corporation, upon the terms

and conditions herein provided.

NOW THEREFORE, in consideration of the mutual agreements and

covenants set forth herein, the Constituent Corporations hereby

agree, subject to the terms and conditions hereinafter set forth,

as follows:

I. MERGER

1.1 Merger. In accordance with the provisions of this

Agreement and the Utah-Business Corporation Act, Flying J Uintah

shall be merged with and into Oil & Gas (the "Merger") and Oil &

Gas shall be, and is herein sometimes referred to as, the

"Surviving Corporation," and the name of the Surviving

Corporation shall be "Flying J Oil & Gas Inc."

1.2 Filing and Effectiveness. The Merger shall become

effective when the following actions shall have been completed:

(a) This Agreement and the Merger shall have been

approved by the Board of Directors of each of the



Corporations and by Parent as the sole shareholder of each of

the Constituent Corporations, in accordance with the

requirements of the Utah Business Corporation Act; and

(b) An executed form of Articles of Merger or an

executed counterpart of this Agreement shall have been filed

with the Utah Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations

and Commercial Code.

The date and time when the Merger shall become effective, as

aforesaid, is herein called the "Effective Date of Merger."

1.3 Certificate of Incorporation. The Articles of

Incorporation of Oil & Gas as in effect immediately prior to the

Effective Date of Merger shall continue in full force and effect

as tae Articles of Ïncorporation of the surviving Corporation

until duly amended in accordance with the provisions thereof and

applicable law.

1.4 Bylaws. The Bylaws of Oil & Gas as in effect immediately

prior to the Effective Date of Merger shall continue in full

force and effect as the Bylaws of the Surviving Corporation until

duly amended in accordance with the provisions thereof and

applicable law.

1.5 Directors and Officers. The directors and officers of

Oil & Gas immediately prior to the Effective Date of Merger shall

be the directors and officers of the Surviving Corporation until

their successors shall have been elected and qualified or until

otherwise provided by law, the Articles of Incorporation of



Surviving Corporation, or the Bylaws of the Surviving

. ENTRY 9300÷995
Corporation• Boor 55ó PAGE¯ 22

1.6 Effect of Merger. Upon the Effective Date of Merger, the

separate existence of Flying J Uintah shall cease and Oil & Gas,

as the Surviving Corporation: (i) shall continue to possess all

of its assets, rights, powers and property as constituted

immediately prior to the Effective Date of Merger, and shall

succeed, without other transfer, to all of the assets, rights,

powers and property of Flying J Uintah in the manner of and as

- more fully set forth in Section 71 of the Utah Business

Corporation Act, and (ii) shall continue to be subject to all of

its debts, liabilities and obligations as constituted immediately

prior to the Effective Date of Merger and shall succeed, without

other transfer, to all of the debts, liabilities and obligations

of Flying J Uintah in the same manner as if Oil & Gas had itself

incurred them, all as more fully provided under the applicable

provisions of section 71 of the Utah Business Corporation Act.

II. MANNER OF CONVERSION OF STOCK

2.1 Flying J Uintah Common Stock. Upon the Effective Date of

Merger, each of the Flying J Uintah Shares shall, by virtue of

the Merger and without any action by the holder of such shares or

any other person, be cancelled.

2.2 Oil & Gas Common Stock. Upon the Effective Date of

Merger, each of the Oil & Gas Shares shall remain fully paid and
non-assessable shares of the duly issued and outstanding Common

Stock of Oil & Gas, as the Surviving Corporation.

-4-
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3.1 Covenants of Oil & Gas. Oil & Gas covenants and agrees

that it will, on or before the Effective Date of Merger:

(a) Qualify to do business as a foreign corporation in

any jurisdictions where such a qualification is required,

including the States of North Dakota, Wyoming and Montana, and

in connection therewith establish a registered office and a

registered agent if and as required by each state's respective

corporation law.

(b) File any and all documents with the tax authority of

the State of Utah necessary to the assumption by Oil & Gas of

all the Utah state tax liabilities of Flying J Uintah.

(c) Taka such other actions as may be required by the

Utah Business Corporation Act.

3.2 Abandonment. At any time before the Effective Date of

Merger, this Agreement may be terminated and the Merger may be

abandoned for any reason whatsoever by the Board of Directors of

either Flying J Uintah-or Oil & Gas or both, notwithstanding the

approval of this Agreement by Parent, as the sole shareholder of

Flying J Uintah and Oil & Gas.

3.3 Amendment. The Boards of Directors of the Constituent

Corporations may amend this Agreement at any time prior to the

filing of Articles of Merger of a counterpart of this Agreement

with the Utah Department of Commerce, provided that an amendment

made subsequent to the approval of this Agreement by the Parent

as the sole shareholder of the Constituent Corporations shall



not: (1) alter or change the amount or kind of shares,

securities, cash, property and/or rights to be received in

exchange for or on conversion of all or any of the shares of any

class or series thereof of such Constituent Corporation; (2)

alter or change any term of the Certificate of Incorporation of

the Surviving Corporation to be effected by the merger or

consolidation; or (3) alter or change any of the terms and

conditions of this Agreement if such alteration or change would

adversely affect the Parent as the holder of the Flying J Uintah

Shares and the Oil & Gas Shares.

3.4 Registered Office. The registered office of the

Surviving Corporation in the State of Utah is located at 50 West

990 South, Brigham City, Utah 84603. O. Jay Call is the

registered agent of the Surviving Corporation at such address.

3.5 Governing Law. This Agreement shall in all respects be

construed, interpreted and enforced in accordance with and

governed by the laws of the State of Utah applicable to contracts

entered into and to be performed entirely within such state.

3.6 Counternarts. In order to facilitate the filing and

recording of this Agreement, the same may be executed in any

number of counterparts, each of which shall be deemed to be an

original.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, this Agreement, having first been approved

by resolution of the Boards of Directors of Flying J Uintah and

Oil & Gas and by resolution of Parent as the sole shareholder of

each of the Constituent Corporations, is hereby executed on



ENTRY 93004995

behalf of each of the Constituent Corporations aË'Ë"a esfáÛc LE29

their respective officers thereunto duly authorized.

FLYING J OIL & GAS INC., FLYING J UINTAE INC.,

a Utah corporation a Utah corporation

By: By:
F Phillip dams, President Jy<' Phillip Adams, President

ATTEST: ATTEST:

-7-
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STATE OF UTAH
ENTP.Y BÛÜDEPARTMENTOF COMMERCE

..

-DIVISION OF CORPORATIONS AND COMMERCIALCODE Scor, Äá

1 hereby cert fy that the foregoing is a true
copy of 'Ú¾ t i

and the endorsements Abereon, is the same is
taken from and compared with the original filed
ln the offi of this Division on the o
day of ,rr ©(AABK A.D. ¡ Vu/ andnow rema ng on file a of record therein.

PETER VAN AL*TYNE
DIVISiON DIRECTOR

Date ' File #
f;



WHENRECO, e, RETURN TO:
Flying J tah Inc. TRYNO. ATEL L. TIME..! ...J'.L.. BOOK Ltl 2!.0PME
1\ttn: Lavonne Garrison-St r ' RECORDEDAT REQUEST OF.. .e.

P. O. Box 540180 es a DUCHESNG COUNTY RFCOÑO Dyr
North Salt Lake, UT 84054-0180 \

ASSIGNHENT

For good and valuable consideration, the receipt and sufficiency of which ishereby acknowledged, FLYING J INC., hereinafter called Assignor, does hereby give
grant, assign, transfer and convey unto FLYING J UINTAH INC., hereinafter called
Assignee, all of Assignor's right, title, and interest, of whatsoever kind and
character, lying within the following described sections located in Duchesne
and/or Uintah Counties, Utah.

Townsþip 1 North, Rapre 1 West, USM
Sections: 20, 21, 22, 23, 26, 27, 28, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35

Townshio 1 North. Ranae 2 West. USM
Sections: 26, 31, 34, 35

Townshio 1 South. Ranze 1 East. USM
Sections: 10, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 22, 23, 24, 25 26, 27, 29,

30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35

Townshio 1 South. Ranze 1 West. USM
Sections: 2, 4, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 21, 22, 23,

25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36

Townshio 1 South. Ranze 2.East. USM
Section: 30

Townshio 1 South, anne 2 West. USM
Sections: 1, 2, 3, 5, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 20,

21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 28, 29, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36

Townshio 1 South. Ranne 3 West. USE
Sections: 5, 6, 8, 9, 10, 15, 16, 17, 20, 21, 29, 30, 32, 33

Townshio 1 South. Ranae 4 West. USN
Sections: 13, 14, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 24, 26, 28, 29, 30, 33, 35
Townshio 1 South. Range 5 West. USM
Sections: 24, 25, 35

Townshio 2 South. Ranze 1 East. USM
Sections: 2, 5, 6, 7, 10, 18, 19

Townshio 2 South. Ranne 1 West. USM
Sections: 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 15, 16, 17, 18, 20,

21

Townshio 2 South. Ranae 2 West. USM
Sections: 2, 3, 4, 5, 7, 8, 10, 11, 14, 17, 18, 19, 23

Townshio 2 South. Ranze 3 West. USM
Sections: 2, 4, 5, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 14, 16, 20, 21, 22, 23,

24, 26, 27, 28

Townshio 3 South. Ranne 5 West. USN
Sections: 14, 15, 16

Townshio a South. Ranne 6 West. USM
Section: 26

Townshio 6 South. Ran«e 20 East. SLM
Section: 14

Townshio 6 South. Ranne 21 East. SLM
Sections: 6, 18, 19

This assignment also covers and includes all of Assignor's interest in all wells,equipment, personal property, and fixtures located on the lands and all contractsand agreements to which these properties are



It is the intent of Assignor to convey to Assignee all of their currently ownedinterest in Duchesne and Uintah Counties, Utah, in case a description has beenomitted from this Assignment.

The interests assigned are conveyed subject to all burdens currently affectingAssignor's interest on the date of this Assignment.

Dated this 9th day of August 1990.

ASSIGNOR, FLYING J INC.

By:

STATE OF )
) ss.

COUNTY 01 Aab>)

On the 9th day of August, 1990, personally appeared before me, ÍÊ±½ydE Ger cc
, to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn, did saythat he is the Recorvue Orsarl<eb of FLYING J INC., that said instrumentwas signed in behalf of said corporation by authority of its Board of Directors,and acknowledged said instrument to be the free act and deed of said corporation.

Witness by hand änd seal this 9th day of August, 1990.

Notary



Wiß¾ RB.ußDED, ATEÛtg9 '9 flME 02 BOOK A,½ FM g?gFlying J Inc. • RECORDEDAT REQUESTOF. OneP. O. Box 540180 11h yt a Aorm, DUCHESNECOUNTYRECORDER wa14 ku * DEPUNorth Salt Lake, Ur 84054-0180 1 yAttn: LaVonne Garrison-Stringer
fiN i ÛBK P UL$

ASSIGNMENT MMill O'\lU'O fl UIMMH CO ÖÒËÏÕŠ(

For good and valuable consideration, the receipt and sufficiency of hIoh ishereby acknowledged, FLYING J UINTAH INC., hereinafter called Assignor, does
hereby give grant, assign, transfer and convey unto FLYING J INC., hereinaftercalled Assignee, all of Assignor's right, title, and interest, of whatsoever kindand character, lying within the following described sections located in Duchesne
and/or Uintah Counties, Utah.

Townshio 1 North. Ranne 1 West. USM
Sections: 20, 21, 22, 23, 26, 27, 28, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35
Townshin 1 North. Ranne 2 West. USN
Sections: 26, 31, 34, 35

Townshio 1 South. Ranne 1 East. USM
Sections: 10, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 22, 23, 24, 25 26, 27, 29,30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35

Townshio 1 South. Ranne 1 West. USN
Sections: 2, 4, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 21, 22, 23,

25, 26_, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36

Townshio 1 South'..Ranne 2 East. USH
Seotion: 30

Townshio 1 South. Ranne 2 West. USH
Sections: 1, 2, 3, 5, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 20,

21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 28, 29, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36

Townshio 1 South. Ranze 3 Nest. USM
sections: 5, 8, 9, 10, 15, 16, 17, 20, 21, 29, 30, 32, 33
TownshiD 1 South. Ranne 4 Nest. USM
Sections: 13, 14, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 24, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 33,35

Townshio 1 South. Ranae 5 West. USN
Sections: 24, 25, 35

Townshio 2 South. Ranae 1 East. USH
Sections: 2, 5, 6, 7, 10, 18, 19

Townshio 2 South. Ranae 1 West. USM
Sections: 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 15, 16, 17, 18, 20,

21

Townshin 2 South, Ranze 2 West. USM
Sections: 2, 3, 4, 5, 7, 8, 10, 11, 14, 17, 18, 19, 23, 24

Townshio 2 South. Ranne 3 West. USM
Sections: 2, 4, 5, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 14, 16, 20, 21, 22, 23,24, 26, 27, 28

TownshiD 3 South. Ranze 5 West. USM
Sections: 14, 15, 16, 26

Townshin 6 South. Ranae 20 East. USM
Section: 14

Townshin 6 South. Ranne 21 East. USM
Sections: 6, 18, 19

This assignment also covers and includes all ofAssignor's interest in all wells,equipment, personal property, and fixtures located on the lands and all contractsand agreements to which these properties are



It is the intent of Aaalgnor to convey to Assi6nee all of their currently ownedInterest in buohenne and Vintah Counties, Utah, in case a description han beenomitted from this Aasignment.

The intereats asalgned are conveyed subject to all burdens ourrently affectingAssignor's interest on the date of this Ansignment.
Dated thia 7th day of August 1990.

3¿SASSIONOR, FLYING J DINTAH INC.

) as.courrr or yg
On the 7th day of August, 1990, personally appeared before me,E- (yermer

, to me personally known, who, being by me duly auorn, did anythat be le the fa > URt Êrda<a¥ of FLTING J DINTAR INC., that saidinstrument was a.igned in behalf of said corporation by authority of its Boardof Directors, and acknowledged said instrumant to be the free act and deed ofsaid corporation.

Vitnese by hand and goal thia 7th day of August, 1990 .

Notary Publio'
r--------

-----

oc OlBELreenwood D&eBr am City,Utah 84302CommissionWms IL Fe 1

------------- J

State of Utah ss.
County of Duchesne

I, ...................

.9.U.l...Ï2.BS.t.,.Ë?.E.9.ËZ..................................................., County Ilecorder

in and for Duchesne County, hereby certify that the foregoing is a full, true and correct

and now on file and of record in my office.

In witness whereof, I have hereunto set my ha ibd affixek

the official seal of said office, this.....,.............2.9h...... .
....... day of

....Augn.st.........................., 19.,9..0..... , ne
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For good and valuable consideration, the receipt and sufficiency of which ishereby acknowledged, Flying J Inc. and Flying J Exploration and Production Inc.,
hereinafter called Assignors', do hereby give grant, assign, transfer and conveyunto Flying J Uintah Inc., hereinafter called Assignee, all of Assignors' right,title, and interest, of whatsoever kind and character, lying within the followingdescribed sections located in Duchesne and/or Uintah Counties, Utah.

Townpþ‡p 1 North, Rance 1 West, USM
Sections: 20, 21, 22, 23, 26, 27, 28, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35

Se i
a:1 No6rth, Ra34 5West, U.SM

Township 1 South, Rapae 1 East, USM
Sections: 10, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 22, 23, 24, 25 26, 27, 29,

30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35

Township 1 South, Rance 1 West, USM
Sections: 2, 4, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 21, 22, 23,

25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36

Townshio 1 South. Ranze 2 East. USM
Section: 30

Township 1 outh. Ran«e 2 West. USM
Sectionse 1, 2, 3, 5, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 20,

21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 2R, 29, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36

Townshjp 1 South, Ranze B West, USM
Sections: 5, 8, 9, 10, 15, 16, 17, 20, 21, 29, 30, 32, 33
Township 1 South, Rapre 4 West, USP
Sections: 13, 14, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 24, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 33,

35

Townshio 1 South. Ranze 5 West. USM
Sections: 24, 25, 35

TownshiD 2 South, Range 1 East. USN
Sections: 2, 5, 6, 7, 10, 18, 19

Townshio 2 South. Rance 1 West. USN
Se'otions: 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 15, 16, 17, 18, 20,

Township 2 South, Rapre 2 West, USN
* Sections: 2, 3, 4, 5, 7, 8, 10, 11, 14, 17, 18, 19, 23, 24ilk

Townshio 2 South, Ranze 3 West. USM
Sections: 2, 4, 5, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 14, 16, 20, 21, 22, 23,

24, 26, 27, 28

ToWDahip 3 South, Rapre 5 West, USM
Sections: 14, 15, 16, 26

Townshio 6 South. Ranze 20 East. USN
Section: 14

Townshio 6 South. Ranne 21 East. USM
Sections: 6, 18, 19

This assignment also covers and includes all of Assignors' interest in all wells,equipment, personal property, and fixtures located on the lands and all contractsand agreements to which these properties are



Assignment
Flying J Inc. to Flying J Uintah Inc.
June 25, 1990
Page 2

It is the intent of Assignors to convey to Assignee all of their currently owned
interest in Duchesne and Uintah Counties, Utah, in case a description has been
omitted from this Assignment.

The interests assigned are conveyed subject to all burdens currently affecting
Assignor's interest on the date of this Assignment.

Dated this hday of June 1990.

ATTEST FLYING J INC.

Executive Vice President

ATTEST FLYING J EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION INC.

mes W. Wilson n B. Scales
ssistant Secretary ice President/Ceneral Manager

STATE OF I )
) ss.

COUNTY OF )

On the 26th day of June, 1990, personally appeared before me, Barre C.
Burgon and J. Phillip Adagsto me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn,
did say that they are the Secretary and Executive Vice Pres,of Flying J
Inc., that said instrument was signed in behalf of said corporation by authority
of its Board of Directors, and acknowledged said instrument to be the free act
and deed of said corporation.

Witness by hand and seal this 2hlhday of June, 1990.

Notary Publio

L..............-..................ISTATE OF LifafN )
) ss.

COUNTY OF )

On the C day of June, 1990, personally appeared before me, John R.
Scales and James W. Wilson, to me personally known, who, being by me duly sworn,
did say that they are the Vice President and Assistant Secretary of Flying J
Exploration and Production Inc., that said instrument was signed in behalf of
said corporation by authority of its Board of Directors, and acknowledged said
instrument to be the free act and deed of said corporation.

Witness by hand and seal thisc day of June,



Page No. 1
06/19/95

COMMUNITIZATION AGREEMENTS
UTAH STATE OFFICE

COMMAGREEMENTNO. CRS NUMB. OPERATOR ACRES SEC DESCRIP. SEC TWN RNG EFFECTIVE COUNTY
DATE

96-000111 UTU58815 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 8 01S 01W 04/01/73 DUCHESNE
96-000109 UTU58813 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 29 01S 01W 11/01/73 DUCHESNE
UTO80491-84C729 UTU60873 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 15 01S 01W 10/22/84 DUC & UIN
UTO8049I-84C730 UTU66535 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 10 01S 01W 09/26/84 UIN & DUC
VR49I-84679c UTU60980 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 480.000000 S2N2,S2 23 01S 01W 05/04/83 UINTAH
VR49I-84685C UTU60991 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 16 01S 01W 03/27/84 DUCHESNE
VR49I-84691C UTU61000 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 22 01S 01W 12/05/83 DUC & UIN
VR49I-84689C UTU60994 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 560.000000 IRR 17 01S 01E 01/26/77 UINTAH
VR49I-84683C UTU60985 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 14 01S 01E 02/22/81 UINTAH
VR49I-84677C UTU60970 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 36 01S 01W 05/10/79 UINTAH
VR49I-84673C UTU60965 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 27 01S 01W 09/17/83 DUCHESNE
VR49I-84671C UTU60953 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 21 01S 01W 06/26/83 DUCHESNE
VR49I-84670C UTU60952 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 12 01S 01W 05/06/83 UINTAH
UTO80149-85C705 UTU60907 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 26 01N 01W 02/18/85 UINTAH
UTO80I49-85C680 UTU60892 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 21 01N 01W 09/20/83 DUCHESNE
UTO80149-84C712 UTU60886 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 480.000000 IRR 29 01S 01E 02/10/82 UINTAH
UTO80I49-84C713 UTU60887 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 28 01N 01W 04/15/82 DUCHESNE
NW-644 UTU60836 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 14 01S 04W 08/29/73 DUCHESNE
NRM-696 UTU60813 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 17 01S 03W 03/12/74 DUCHESNE
CR-I-157 UTU60782 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 440.000000 IRR 30 01S 01E 02/24/82 UINTAH
CR-I-156 UTU60781 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 26 01S 04W 02/05/82 DUCHESNE
96-000115 UTU58819 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 22 01S 04W 07/23/73 DUCHESNE
9C-000176 UTU58860 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 33 01S 01E 08/24/78 UINTAH
NW-616 UTU60833 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 28 02S 03W 02/01/73 DUCHESNE
Uf080149-86C681 UTU60915 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 15 01S 01E 04/03/81 UINTAH
96-000100 UTU58805 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 638.500000 ALL 31 01N 01W 01/02/74 DUCHESNE
9C-000122 - UTU58826 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 32 01N 01W 06/01/74 DUCHESNE
9C-000144 UTU58848 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 33 01N 01W 12/02/75 DUCHESNE
9C-000149 UTU58852 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 34 01S 01E 11/05/76 UINTAH
90-000173 UTUS8858 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 35 01S 01E 05/11/78 UINTAH
90-000175 UTU58859 FLYINGJ OIL & GAS INC. 520.000000 E2,E2W2,sWSW 27 01S 01E 06/27/78 UINTAH
90-000171 UTU58857 FLYING J OIL & GAS INC. 640.000000 ALL 23 01S 01E 01/31/78 UINTAH

JUN 2 1 1995

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&
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't United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF INDIAN AFFAIRS

UINTAH AND OURAY AGENCY
FORT DUCHESNE, UTAH 84026

(800 722-2406
Ext. 51/52/54IN REPLY REFER TO:

Minerals and Mining

Name Change

JUN 2 3 1995 '

Flying J Oil and Gas, Inc. DV OF OIL,GAS&MN O
Attention· Coralie Timotby -

P. O. Box 540180
N. Salt Lake City, UT 84054-0180

Dear Coralie:

As discussed on the telephone regarding the name changes of various Flying J and its subsidiaries, we
have reviewed all documents submitted, and hereby approve of the name change for the following
companies.

Flying J Uintah Inc. to Flying J Oil & Gas Inc.
Flying J Inc. to Flying J Uintah Inc.
Flying J Uintah Inc. to Flying J, Inc.
Flying J Inc. and Flying J Exploration and Production Inc.

to Flying J Uintah Inc.

All records will be changed to reflect that Flying J Oil & Gas, Inc. will be operator of the subject wells
listed on the attached sheet. With the exception of the following·

CA No. VR49I84-679C Bradley 1-23A1 ÅÊ/9"
CA No. VR49I-84691C Fred Bassett 1-22A1 ///A 7-7- / Y"

The sundries submitted indicate a change of operator from Badger Oil Corporation to Flying J Oiland
Gas, Inc. This requires the Designation of Operator forms to be completed and approved by this office.

If you have any questions regarding the above, please contact this office.

Sincerely,

ce: Tãsha Cordova, Utah State Office
Theresa Thonpson, BLM State Office
Margie Hermann, Vernal BLM District Office
Energy & Minerals, Ute Indian Tribe
Ute Distribution Corporation, Roosevelt,
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Circulate For Your Information See Me
Comment investigate Signature
Coordination Justify

REM K

DO NOT u this rm RECORD of approvals, concurrences, disposals,clearances, and similar actions
FROM:(Name rg.symbol, Agency/Post) Room No.-Bldg.

Phone No.
5041.102 PTIONtLFORM41 (Rev.7-76)
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Division öf Gil, Gas and Mining
OPERATOR CHANGEHORKSHEET "°"

Ltach all documentation received by the division regarding this change. 2- 7-PL

Initial each listed item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable. 8-5
4-VLC IL

II Change of Operator (we+‡-Ge‡4) O Designation of Agent 5-RJF

O Designation of Operator H0perator Name Changede+y-

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed (EFFECTIVE DATE: 1-2-91

TO (new operator) FLYING J OIL & GAS INC FROM (former operator) FLYING J INC
(address) PO DRANER 130 (addreSS) PO DRANER 130

ROOSEVELT UT 84066 ROOSEVELT UT 84066
C/O FLYING J O&G INC

phone ( 801) 722-5166 phone (801 )722-5166
account no. N 8080 account no. N1195

Hell(s) (attach additional page if needed):

Name: **SEE ATTACHED** API:04¾3DWÛEntity: Sec Twp___Rng Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec_ _Twp __Rng _ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec__ Twp___Rng __ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec___Twp___Rng Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec___Twp___Rng __ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec _Twp___Rng___ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec _Twp___Rng_ _ Lease Type:

OPERATORCHANGEDOCUHENTATION

1. (Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or other legal documentation has been received from former
operator (Attach to this form). (4,g ç¡ppg)

2. (Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or other legal documentation has been received from new operator
(Attach to this form). (£.// /446)

3. The Department of Commerce has been contacted if the new operator above is not currently
operating any wells in Utah. Is company registered with the state? (yes/no) If
yes, show company file number: .

4. (For Indian and Federal Hells ONLY) The BLM has been contacted regarding this change
(attach Telephone Documentation Form to this report). Make note of BLM status in
comments section of this form. Management review of Federal and Indian well operator
changes should take place prior to completion of steps 5 through 9 below.

5. Changes have been entered in the 011 and Gas Information System (Wang/IBM) for each well
listed above. (¿-943)

6. Cardex file has been updated for each well listed above. 7./¿.jy-

7. Hell file labels have been updated for each well listed above.g.j,g,gf-

8. Changes have been included on the monthly "Operator, Address, and Account Changes" memo
for distribution to State Lands and the Tax Commission. (g,ysfÿÿ

69. A folder has been set up for the Operator Change file, and a copy of this page has been
placed there for reference during routing and processing of the original documents.

- OVER



OPERATOR CHANGEHORKSHEET (CONTINUED) Initial each item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable.

ENTITY REVIEH

CŒ 1. (Rule R615-8-7) Entity assi nments have been reviewed for all wells listed above. Here
entity changes made? (yes/(no (If entity assignments were changed, attach copies of
Form 6, Entity Action FormT.

gg 2. State Lands and the Tax Commission have been notifi'ed through normal procedures of
entity changes.

BONDVERIFICATION (Fee wells only) /

1. (Rule R615-3-1) The new operator of any fee lease well listed above has furnished a
proper bond.

2. A copy of this form has been placed in the new and former operators' bond files.

B‡_ 3. The former operator has requested a release of liability from their bond (yes/no) .

Today's date 19 . If yes, division response was made by letter
dated 19 .

LEASE INTEREST OHNER NOTIFICATION RESPONSIBILITY

l. (Rule R615-2-10) The former operator/lessee of any fee lease well listed above has been
notified by letter dated 19___, of their responsibility to notify any
person with an interest in such lease of the change of operator. Documentation of such
notification has been requested.

2. Copies of documents have been sent to State Lands for changes involving State leases.

FILMI

1. All attachments to this form have been microfilmed. Date: (~),,s/g gl/ 19 9 .

FILING

1. Copies of all attachments to this form have been filed in each well file.

2. The oraing of this form and the original attachments have been filed in the Operator
Change



Fono lo STATE OF UTAH
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 2

355 West North Temple, 3 Triad, Suite 350, Salt Lake City, UT 84180-1203

MONTHLY OIL AND GAS PRODUCTION REPORT

OPERATOR NAME AND ADDRESS:
UTAH ACCOUNT NUMBElt

Nl 195

C/0 FLYING J 0&G INC 2 / 95REPORT PERIOD (MONTH/YEAR):
FLYING J INC
PO DRAWER 130/G ROBB
ROOSEVELT UT 84066 AMENDED REPORT (HigMigh Clumges)

Well Name Producing Well Days Production Volumes

API Number Entity location Zone Status Oper OIL(BBL) GAS(MCF) WATER(BBL)
Vt.J. HACKFORD 1-23

4304730279 00790 015 01E 23 GR-W jd-Û0G|Ÿ/
JUTE TRIBAL l-35AlE

4304730286 00795 015 01E 35 GR-W 2ÀÁÊ2ÝÊ-d?ð/ŸÑ
JUTE TRIBAL l-27AlE

4304730421 00800 015 01E 27 GR-W £ÎlŠ22ÑÀ R d&/YS CYd

/DAVIS 1-33
4304730384 00805 OIS 01E 33 GR-W r jd-J2t/'/ diµ )

L/DTE TRIBAL 1-22AlE
.

4304730429 00810 ois 01E 22 GRRVL / lË/$ 'Ÿ//9 Ÿ6Ë /
LARSEN 1-25Al

'04730552 00815 015 01W 25 GR-WS ÍL66
.,Y GULCH 1-36Al ,-'

4304730569 00820 ois olW 36 GR-wk EL2 O/f/-ÛŸ$Ÿi dàJQ
NELSON 1-31AlE ,t'

4304730671 00830 015 01E 31 GR-W CL

ROSEMARY LLOYD l-24AlE ,x

4304730707 00840 015 01E 24 GR-W / CL
H.D. LANDY l-30AlE 72

4304730790 00845 ois 01E 10 GR-W Ce (16-1-/67 (à:Ja)
JUTE TRIBAL l-15AlE /

4304730820 00850 015 01E 15 GR-wk ht/h2/7/7 trorferk / t's
WALKER l-14AlE ,,*

4304730805 00855 015 01E 14 GR-W A- f/Ÿf/-fŸÁÑA
v UTE TRIBAL 1-l7AlE yr

,

A304730829 00860 ois 01E 17 GR-wk / 2tÑ/,24ff VP/1/-f¥áffd fr/

TOTALS

X)MMENT3:

hereby certify that this report is true and complete to the best of my knowledge. Dale·

Aamo and Senature: Telephone Number



Form 9 STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 6. Lease Designation and Serial Number
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING Fee

7. Indian Allottee or Tribe Name

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use tills form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 8. Unit or Communitization Agreement

Ute APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-for such proposals CA #CR-I-157
1. Type of Well 9. Well Name and Number°

,, O Gw¶, O Other(spec* Landy 1-30A1E
2. Name of Operator 10. API Well Number

Flying J Oil and Gas Inc 43-047-30790
3. Address of Operator 4. Telephone Numbei 11. Field and Pool, or Wildcat

PO Drawer 130 Roosevel t, Utah 84066 801-722-5166 Bl uebel l
S. Location of Well

.1525' FNL 2037' FWL UintahFootage County :
QQ. Sec. T., R., M. Sec 30 T1S R1E mate : UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OH OÏHËHIÏA LA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

O Abandonment New Construction Q Abandonment * New Construction
O Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing Q Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing
O Change of Plans O Recompletion O Change of Plans O Shoot or Acidize
O Conversion to injection Shoot or Acidize Conversion to Injection Vent or Flare
O Fracture Treat Vent or Flare Fracture Treat Water Shut-Off
O MultipleCompletion WaterShut-OH g Other Pit Reclamation
O orner

Date of Work Completion
Approximate Date Work Will Start

Report results of MultipleCompletions and Recompletions to different reservoirs
on WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION ANO LOG form.

Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.
13. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell is directionally drilled, give subsurfacelocations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

The emergency pit reclamation on the above mentioned well
has been accomplished as per our original Sundry.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true d correct
PTOduction

Larry Rich Superintendent 8/31/95Name & Signature
Title Date

(State Use Or

(8/90)
See instructions on Reverse



APR-18-00TUE01:47 PM REVENUE FAXNO.14357225 P. 03/17

Form3160-5
(December1989)

UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR BudgetBureau No.11004·oiss

BUREAUOF LANDMANAGEMENT Expires,September30.1990
5. Lease DesigAallon and Serisi Na

SUNDRY NOTICEAND REPORTS ON WELLS Fee
Donotuse thisform forpropossisto drillof to deepen or reentrylo a driferent reservoir. 5. IfIndian,Allottee or Triba Namo

Use"APPLICATIONFOAPERMIT-" forsuchproposals

SUBMITINTRIPucA TE 7. If unitor cA . Agreement Designation

1. Titioofwon CRii57

[ X] OilWell [ ] Gas Well ] Olher

2 Namo ofOperator 8. WellNameandNo.

HD Landy 1-30A1E
3. Adciress and Telephone No. 9. API wellNo.

PO DRAWER 130 ROOSEVELT,UTAH84066 435-722-5188 43-047-30790
4. Lacation ofWell (Poetage,Se.. T., R.,M., or SurveyDescription 10. Field andPool.er Explornlory Aron

Bluebell
1525' FNL 203T FWL n.countyorearish.state

Sec 30 T18 R1E Uintah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s)TO INDICATENATURGOF NOTICE,REPOR T,OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SU ISSION TYPE OF ACIION
[ ] Noticeof Intent [ ] Abandonment ( ) Change of Plans
(X ] Subsequent Report ( ) Recompletion [ ] New Construction

( ] FInal Abandonment Notice [ } Plugging Back [ ] Non-Routine Fracturing
[ ] Casing Repair ( ) Water Shut-Off

[ ] AlteringCasing ( ] Converslon to Injection
[X ] Other Perf and Acidize

(NoteReport resultsof mullspiocompletianon WeilCompiglioner

RecompletianReport and LDOform)

13 Describe Proposeder Completed Operagons(CI¢ntly slala allpertinentdetallt., andgivepartlnentdeles,beludingestimateddelocigjortinganyÞroposed work. ifw il si

diftCUOnaKydrilled , givg NbygrfaCO 1000tl0nand measuredand ifue vanicaldopihnforallmarkersand zones pertinent to thiswork.

Perforated 12' zone @12,390'to 12,402' w/3SPF, 36 holes.
Acidized perforations 12,390' to 12,402 with 1000 gal 15% HCLwladditives.
Acidized perforations from 11,450' to 12,402' with 20,000 gal 15% HCLwladditivos.
Returned wellto production 2/24/00.

14 Ihereby settilythat tho 90stng 19 tract

Signed 44µ . Title on Superintendent Date 3/8/00
( ,

/ '
.

/ LarryRich

(Thisspaco forFederni f State DIficeuso)
Aposoved by

.
Title Dain

Tdio 10 U.S C. Section1001, makes it a crimeforanyp¢rsen knOWingly and wllifullyle makela anydepartmen10r allencyofthe United slates any(sist, facillios.tsor fraudulent statementeor
tilpfDIGnt200ns itt 10 Ony mangtWIddA



APR-18-00TUE01:47 PN REVENUE FAXNO,14357225 P, 04/17

.

Location: Sec30 Tl IE USM SE/NW Well: HD Landy 1-30A1E
UintahCounty,Utah WI: 63.809190%

TD: 12,950' R1: 53.218940%
PBTD: 12,944' Spud Date: 9/4/80
Perfs: 11,504'- 12,900' Accounting #: 77080
Formation: Wasatch GR: 5421'
Field: East Bluebell KB: 5435'

2/11/00 AFE#4300119
Perf and TestWasatch,Acidize
12:30pm to 5:30pm MIRUrig and equipment. Removehorseshead. PU on rods and tbg
was waxed oR Pumped 50 bb1s250degwtr dn osg to heattbg. Unseatpump. Try to flush
tbg, still waxie. Strokorodswhilepumpingvery slowlydowntbg @1000psi for 15bbis
@250 deg. Prcas droppedof Flushed tbg w/ another45 bble 250 deg wtr. SWI and
SDFN. 5:30pm to 6:00pm CrowTravel.

Daily and CummCosts: $ 1,689.50

2/12/00 AFE #4300119
6:30am to 7:am Crewtravel. 7:am to 11:30amSITP50 psi, bledpress off. POOHw/ rods

and pump. RD rod equipment. RU tbg equipment. Rig engine not reving up right. SWI
andSDFN. 11:30am to 12:00pm Crow Travel.

Daily Costs: 5 1,777.00 CummCosts: $ 3,466.50

2/13/00 AFE # 4300119
SlFS.

2/14/00 AFE # 4300119
STFS.

2/15/00 AFB# 4300119
7:nm to 9:amWell was left open to flowlineover weekend, cagpressure @50 psi. Tbg @
0 psi, bleed off well. ND wollhead,flang,NU BOP's, prepared for tbg, unset TAC @
9,955'. 9:am to 11:amworking on rig engine. 11:am to 5:30pm POOH and tallied@320
jts 2 7/8" 6.5#N-80Brdproduction tbgand BHA. Laiddown BHA, tallied,PU and RTHas
follows: Arrow oil tool 4 1/8"mill, 5" esg scrapper,bit sub, 90 jts 6.5# P-l05 8td work
string & 20 jts 2 7/8" 6.5# N-80 Brdproduction tbg. EOT @3,456'. SWIFN. 5:30pm
SDFN.

Daily Costs: $ 2,593.00 Cumm Costs: $



APR-18-00TUE01'47 PM REVENUE FAXNO.1457225 P. 05/17

Location: Sec30 TI. JE USM SE/NW Well: HDLandy 1-30A1E
UiutahCounty, Utah WI: 63.809190%

TD: 12,950' RI: 53.218940%
PBTD: 12,944' spudDate: 9/4/80
Perfs: 11,504'- 12,900' Accounting #: 77080
Formation: Wasatch GR: 5421'
Field: East Bluebell KB: 5435'

2/16/00 AFE # 4300119
7:am Well was left opento flow line ovemight. Csg pressure @100psi, tbg @0 psi.
B1codoff well, continuedRTHw/ 4 1/8" mill & 5" csg scrapper, 294jts 2 7/8" production
tbg @406 jts total,cleanedout to 12,577'. Note: Did not tag liner topor fill, POOH w/
tbg and mill, flushing tog as needed to clean tbg. Laid down tools. Prepared for
perforators. Leftesg open to flowline for night. 3:30pm SDFN.

Daily Costs: $ 2,408.00 CummCosts: S 8,467.50

2/17/00 AFE#4300119
7:am SIWP @0 psi. RU OWP wirelineservice to set 5" PDQXCIBP@12,450'. Note;
Nothing was put on topof CIBP, PU 3 1/8" HP esg gun toperforato 12' zone @12,390' to
12,402'w/ 3 SPF, 36 holes. Secn no pressureafter perforating, RDMO OWP witclinc. PU
Arrowoil tool5" HD pkr & RIH as follows: PKRnew 2 7/8" + 45 PSN, 90 jts 2 7/8" 6.5#
P-105 Brdwork string, 307 jts 2 7/8" 6.5# N-80 Brd production tbg, set pkr clements @
12,350' w/ @20,000#compression.SWIFN. 3:30pm SDFN.

Daily Costs: $ 7,297.00 CummCosts: 5 15,764.50

2/18/00 AFE#4300119
7am SITP, slight blow,SICP@50psi, MIRUSchlumbergerDowell topump @1000 gal
15% HCL acid containinginhibitors,clay stabilizer, chelating agent surfactant and scale
inhibitoradditivesin to perforations @12,390' to 12,402', 36 holes, w/ Arrowoil tools 5"
HD pkr set @12,350',pumped job as follows@10 bb1swtr, 1000gal 15%HCL acidw/
additivos,flushedw/ @74 bbiswtr. Note: Tbg filled w/ 68.6 bbls, max rate @8 BPM.
Avg rate @3 BPM, Max press @5990psi, Avgpress@4500 psi. Dropped @35 - 7/8"
1.3 divettcr balls total. Seengood ball action, ISTP@5220 psi, 5 min @4449 psi, 10 min
0 psi. RDMOSchlumberger Dowell,RUto swab 109bbls acid job total,starting fluid level
@1,100' made 18 swab nms rec, @55 bble fluid total secn trace of oil on last two runs,
ending fluid level @10,200' ending pH @7. RD swab, drained lines, SWIFN. 6:pm
SDFN.

DailyCosts: $ 6,382.00 CummCosts: $ 22,146,50

2/19/00 AFE # 4300119
7:am SICP, slight blow, SITP @ 100psi. RU to bleedofTpressure. Unset 5" pkr, set @
12,350'. POOHw/ tbg and pkr. Note; Rubber was gonc on pkr. PU new Arrow BD pkr,
RTHas follows: PKR, 2 7/8" PSN, 90 jts 6.5# P-105 Brdwork string, 224jts 2 7/8"6.5# N-
80 production tbg, EOT @9,778'. SWIFN.5:pm SDFN.

Daily Costs: S 2,873.00 CummCosts: $



APR-18-00TUE01:48 PM REVENUE FAXNO.14357225 P, 06/17

Location: Sec 30 T1 .1E USM SE/NW Well: HD Landy 1-30A1E
Uintah County,Utah WI: 63,809190%

TD: 12,950' RI: 53.218940%
PBTD: 12,944' Spud Date: 9/4/80
Perfs: 11,504' - 12,900' Accounting #: 77080
Formation: Wasatch GR: 5421'
Field: East Bluebell KB: 5435'

2/20/00 AFE # 4300119
7:am SICP60 psi, SITP60 psi. Bled off well pressure, continuedRIHw/ 54 jts 2 7/8" tbg.
Totaltbgin well is as follows: 278jts2 7/8" 6.5#N-808rdproduction tbg, 90 jts2 7/8" P-
105 Brdwork string, 2 7/8" + 45 PSN,Arrowoil tool 5" HD pkr. Set pkr @11,450' w/
20,000# compression.RU rig pump and filled7" cag& testedto 2500 psi. Using230bols
wtr. Tested good, blod off pressured, drained pump and linod. 11:am SDFN.

Daily Costs: $ 1,590.00 Cumm Costs: $ 26,609.50

2/21/00 AFE # 4300119
SIFS.

2/22/00 AFE# 4300119
7:am MIRU SchlumbergerDowell Serviceto acidizo perforationsfrom 11,450' to 12,402'
w/ 20,000gal 15% HCL acid containing corrosion inhibitor,claystabili7er, chelating agent,
surfatant & scale inhibitoradditives,using600 - 7/8" 1.03ball sealersas diverters. RU rig
pump and lines to esg, fill and set pop offs at 2800psi. Droppedcsg press to 1800psi to
pump acid job as follows: Max rate @11BPM. Avg rato @8.5 BPM, Max Pressuro @
8090 psi, Avg press @7450 psi. Seengood ball action,tog filled w/ 40 bb1s,ISIP4600 psi,
5 min 4175 psi, 10 min 4257 psi, 15 min 4303 psi. Shut in well. RDMO Schlumberger
Dowell Service. RU to bleedolTpressure.SITP @200psi. Wellbled off and flowed@4
bbls. RU swab to recover 561 bbis. Total startingfluid level @650', made 19 runs,
recovered 100 bb1swtr, trace of oil and lotsof acid gas. Ending fluidlevel@6,950'. Noto:
Fluid has been there for the last 5 runs, ending pH 1. Swab,SWIFN. Drainedpump and
lines. 5:30pm SDFN.

Daily Costs: $ 47,219.00 CummCosts: $ 73,828,50

2/23/00 AFE # 4300119
6:30am - 7:am Crewtravel. 7:amto5:30pmSITP 450 psi. Bledpress off (all gas). Started
swabbing. Made 5 runs and recovered28 bblefluid. Starting FL 6950'. EndingFL 7550',
pH 6. RD swabcquip. PU and equalizefluidin cegandtbg. Releasedphr. RU hot oiler
and flushed tbg w/ 30 bbis 270 deg wtr. POOH w/ 320 jts 2 7/8" N-80tbg. POOH. LD 90
jts 2 7/8" P-105tbg, SN andpkr, while hot oiler trickledhot wtr down csg to clean tbg.
SWI and SDFN. 5:30pm to 6:pm Crewtravel.

Daily Costs: $ 3,990.20 CununCosts: $



APR-18-00TUE01:48 PN RFVENUE FAXNO,14357225 P. 07/17

Location: Sec 30 T1 .1E USM SE/NW WeR: HD Landy 1-30AlE
Uintah County, Utah WI: 63.809190%

TD: 12,950' RI: 53.218940%
PBTD: 12,944' Spud Date: 9/4/80
Perfs: 11,504' - l 2,900' Accounting #: 77080
Formation: Wasatch GR: 5421'
Field: East Bluebell KB: 5435'

2/24/00 AFE# 4300119
6:30amto 7:am Crowtravel.7:am to 5;30pm SIP 50 psi. Bled pressoff. RlH w/ 4 ½" gas

anchor, TAC, SN & 320 jts 2 7/8" N-80tbg. Set TAC@9,948' w/ PSN @9,94T. ND
BOP. Landed tbg on Ilange w/ 20,000# tension. NUwellhead, Changeequip overto rods.

Flûsbed tog w/ 60 bb1s270 deg wtr. Rlff w/ rebuiltpump and rods, Spaceout and scat
pump. Filled tbg w/ 30 bb1s wtr. Strokedpump and press test to 800 psi, hc1d. Put on
horseshead and hung off rods. 11adgood pump action.Retamedwell to prod at 5:15pm.
SDFN. 5:30pmto 6:pm Crew travel.

Daily Costs: $ 2,691.33 Cumm Costs: $ 80,510.03

2/25/00 AFE # 4300119
6:30amto 7:am Crew travel. 7:am to 8:30amCheck,well pumping. RD rig and equip.
Move out.
Productionfor24th...
On 18 hrs, 28 oil, 120 wtr, 20 gas, 1.3SPM,30 TP, 20 oil fromflat tank.
Productionfor 256

On 24 hrs, 55 oil, 139wtr,66 gas,7.3 SPM,40 TP
Daily Costs: $ 504.50 CummCosts: $ 81,014.53

Final Workover Report XXXXXXXXXX

2/26/00 AFE # 4300119
Production...
On 24 hrs, 75 oil, 148 wtr, 82 gas, 7.3SPM,45 TP.

2/27/00 AFE # 4300119
On 24 hrs, 82 oil, 145 wtr, 66 gas, 7.3 SPM, 45 TP.

2/28/00 AFE #4300119
24 hrs, 93 oil, 123 wtr, 80 gas, 7.3 SPM, 30 TP.

2/29/00 AFE# 4300119
24 hrs, 75 oil, 80 wtr, 80 gas,7.3 SPM, 30 TP.

3/1/00 APE # 4300119
24 hrs, 80 oil, 62 wtr, 80 gas, 7.3 SPM, 30 TP.

3/2/00 AFE # 4300119
24 hrs, 71 oil, 76 wtr. 80 gas, 7.3 SPM, 40



APR-18-00TUE01'48 PM RDENUE FAXNO.14367225 P. 08/17

Location: See30 TI. .1EUSM SE/NW Well: ' BD Landy 1-30AlE

UintahCounty, Utah WI: 63.809190%
TD: 12,950' RI: 53.218940¾
PBTD: 12,944' Spad Date: 9/4/80
Perfs: 11,504' - 12,900' Accounting#: 77080
Formation: Wasatch GR: 5421'
Field: EastBlucbcll KB: 5435'

3/3/00 AFE # 4300119
24hrs, 70 oil, 58 wtr, 80 gas,7.3 SPM, 30 TP

3/4/00 AFE# 4300119
24 hrs, 57 oil,42 wtr, 80 gas,7.3 SPM, 30 TP

3/5/00 AFE#4300119
24 hrs, 62 oil, 50 wtr, 80 gas, 7.3 SPM,30 TP

3/6/00 AFE # 4300119
24 hrs, 60 oil, 30 wtr, 80 gas,7,3 SPM, 30 TP

FinalProductionReport



APR-18-00TUE01:47 Pfi RFVENUE FAXNO.14357225 P. 02/17

Form o
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES 6. Lease Dosignaionand SerialNumber

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS ANDMINING Fee
7. Indian AHouse or Tribe Nama

SUNDRYNOTICEANDREPORTSONWELLS
Donot usa thisformforproposalslo drillnowwells,deepen existingwells,or tomontarpluggedand 0. UnitorCommunflirailonA0moment

Oband0nod walle CRN57
Use APPLICATIONFORPERMIT- forsuchproposals

9. WelNameand Number

t. Tw.orwen H.D.LANDY1-30A1E
[x; cilweit [ ] Gas well [ ] Other

2. Nameof Operolor 10. API Well Number

Flying J OII and Gas Inc 43-047-30790
3. Addreasand TelephoneNo. 4. TelephoneNumber 11.Fieldand Pool,or ExploraloryArom

PO DraWer 130, Roosevelt, Utah 84066 (435) 722-5166 BLUEBELL
5. LocadonofWell

Footage 1525' FNL2037' FWL County: UINTAH

QQ. Soc. T..R.,M,: SEC 30 T1S R1E State: UTAH

12. CHECKAPPROPRIATSBOX(s)TOINDICATENATUREOF NOTICE,REPORT,OROTHERDATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submitin Duplicate) (Submit originalForm Only)

[ ] Abandonment [ ] New Construction ( ) Abandonment ( ) Wawconstruction
[ ] Casing Repair [ ] Pull or Alter Casing [ ] CasingRepalr ( ] Pullor AlterCasing
[ ] Change of Plans [ ] Recompletion [ ] Change of Plans [ ] Recompletion
[ ] ConversiontoInjection [ ] Shoot ofAcidize [ ] Conversionto injecuon [X ] Shootor Acidizo
[ ] Fracture Test [ ] Ventor Flare [ ] FractureTest ( ) VentorFlare
[ ] MultipleComplellon [ ] Water Shut-oir [ ] MultipleCompleson [ ] WaterShut-Off

( ) Other [ ] Other

Approximate DateWorkWHIstart Date oFWork Completion 2/24/00
Report resulleofMuniple Compiadonsand Recomplodonsto different
resgryolrs on WELLCOMPLETION OR RECOMPLETIONAND
LOGFORM.
*Mustbe accompanied by a cement verification repoit

10. Duncube Proposed orCampluted Opemtlons (Clearlyslateallperinentdelalls, andgive perilnenidales, includin0Dillmated date ofaloitinganyproposed worloifwellle
directionallydnliodävo subeurfacolocutlenuridmonairndund truo vertical dnptiasforallmuskors andkonus portinenttolhis wollt

Perforated 12' zone @12,390'to 12,402' wl38PF, 36 holes.
Acidized perforations 12,390' to 12,402 with 1000 gal 15% HCL wledditives.
Acidized perforations from 11,450· to 12,402·with 20,000 gal 15% HCLwladditives.
Returned we!I to production 2/24/00.

Sign Title ProductionSuperintendent Date 3/8/00
/ / / LarryRich

(sniouseonly)



Form 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 6. Lease Designation and Serial Number

DIVISIONOF OIL, GASAND MINING Fee
7. Indian Allottee or Tribe Name

SUNDRY NOTICE AND REPORTS ON WELLS '

Do not use this formfor proposals todrill new wells, deepen exlstingwells, or to reenter plugged and 8. Unit or CommunitizationAgreement

abandoned wells CRI157
Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT -- for such proposals

9. Wel Name and Number

1. TitleofWell
H.D. LANDY1-30A1E

(X ] Oil Well [ ] Gas Well [ ] Other

2. Name of Operator 10. API Well Number

Flying J Oil and Gas Inc
43-047-30790

3. Address and Telephone No. 4. Telephone Number 11. Fieldand Pool, or ExploratoryArea

PO Drawer 130, Roosevelt, Utah 84066 (435) 722-5166 BLUEBELL

5. Location of Well

Footage 1525' FNL 2037' FWL County: UINTAH

QQ, Sec. T.,R.,M.: SEC 30 T1S R1E State: UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDJCATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT

(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

[ ] Abandonment [ ] New Construction [ ] Abandonment [ ] New Construction

[ ] Casing Repair [ ] Pull or Alter Casing [ ] Casing Repair [ ] Pull or Alter Casing

I ] Change of Plans [ ] Recompletion ( ] Change of Plans [ ] Recompletion

( ] Conversion to Injection [ ] Shoot or Acidize [ ] Conversion to injection [X ] Shoot or Acidize

( ] Fracture Test [ ] Vent or Flare [ ] Fracture Test [ ] Vent or Flare

[ ] Multiple Completion [ ] Water Shut-Off [ ] Multiple Completion [ ] Water Shut-Off

[ ] Other [ ] Other Ë<

Approximate Date Work WillStart Date of WorkCompletion 2/24/00
Repoit results of Multiple Completionsand Recompletions to different

reservoirs on WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION AND
LOG FORM.
*Must be accompanied by a cement verification report

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimateddate ofstarting any proposed work. If well is

directionally drilled , give subsurface location and measured and true vertical depths for allmarkersand zones pertinent to this woric

Perforated 12' zone @12,390'to 12,402' w/3SPF, 36 holes.
Acidized perforations 12,390' to 12,402 with 1000 gal 15% HCL wladditives.
Acidized perforations from 11,450' to 12,402' with 20,000 ga115% HCL wladditives.
Returned well to production 2/24/00.

RECEIVED
MARO9 2000
DIVISIONOF

OIL, GAS AND MINING

reby c ify th goin nect

Title Production Superintendent Date 3/8/00
Larry Rich

(State Use Only)



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

Fee
SUNDRY NOTICE AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINIDAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

Do not use this forrn for proposals to drill new wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom4tolo depth, reenter plugged 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

wells, or to drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for such proposat. CRI157
1. TYPEOF WELLS 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER

[x ] OilWell [ ] Gas Well [ ] Other HD Landy 1-30A1 E
2. NAME OF OPERATOR 9. API NUMBER:

Flying J Oil & Gas Inc 43-047-30790
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

PO Drawer 130 Roosevelt, Ut 84066 435-722-5166 Bluebell
4. LOCATIONOF WELLS

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 1525' FNL 2037' FWL COUNTY: Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: Sec 30 T1S R1E STATE: UTAH

11 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

[x ] NOTICE OF INTENT [x ] ACIDIZE [ ] DEEPEN [x ] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(submitin Duplicate) [ ] ALTER CASING [ ] FRACTURE TREAT [ ] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start [ ] CASING REPAIR [ ] NEW CONSTRUCTION [ ] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
5/21/07 [ ] CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS [ ] OPERATOR CHANGE [ ] TUBINGREPAIR

[ ] CHANGE TUBING [ ] PLUG AND ABANDON [ ] VENT OR FLARE

[ ] SUBSEQUENT REPORT [ ] CHANGE WELL NAME [ ] PLUG BACK [ ] WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only) [ ] CHANGE WELL STATUS ( ] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) { ] WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion: [ ] COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS[ ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE [ ] OTHER
[ ] CONVERT WELL TYPE [ ] RECOMPLETE-DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS, Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Flying J intends to perforate and acidize the Wasatch formations according to the
attached procedure

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Larry Ri TITLE Production Superintendent

SIGNATURE DATE May 18, 2007

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED BYTHE STATE
OF UTAH DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS D MINING

(5/2000) DAT
RECEIVED

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



Flying J Oil & Gas
Workover Procedure
HD Landy 1-30A1E

AFE #

Purpose: Perforate and acidize the Wasatch.

PERTINENT INFORMATION

Well Location: 1525' FNL, 2037' FWL (SENW)
Section 30, Township 1 South, Range 1 East
Uintah County, Utah

Elevation: 5421' GL, 5435' KB

TD: 12,950'

PBTD: 12,450' (CIBP)

API No.: 43-047-30790

Casing: 20" @40' cmt to surface
9 5/8" 40# K55 @2992' cmt to surface
7" 26-32# S95 @10,200' cmt to 7266' (CBL)
5" 18# P110 liner @10,023' - 12,948' cmt w/800 sks H

Tubing: 2 3/8" & 2 7/8" N80

Existing Perforations: Wasatch
11,504' - 12,900', 300 perfs, 150' (11/80)

* 224 perfs, l12', 40 intervals above CIBP @12,450'
12,390' - 12,402', 36 perfs, 12'



Page 2
HD Landy l-30AlE
May 16, 2007

PROCEDURE

1. MIRUSU. Unseat pump, flush rods with hot water as needed, and POOH with
rods and pump. ND wellhead and NU BOP.

2. Release 5" TAC @l1,446', and POOH w/ 2 3/8" & 2 7/8" tbg.

3. RIH with 4 1/8" bit and 5" csg scraper and drill out CIBP at 12,450'. Clean out
to TD (12,950') and POOH.

4. RU wire line company to perforate the Wasatch in the following intervals using
a 4" casing gun, 3 SPF, 120° phasing. Correlate depths to Schlumberger Dual
Induction SFL log dated 10/28/80.

12723 - 12727 (4') 12328 - 12330 (2') 11924 - 11926 (2')
12713 - 12717 (4') 12120 - 12122 (2') 11917 - 11920 (3')
12704 - 12708 (4') 12117 - 12119 (2') 11892 - 11894 (2')
12648 - 12652 (4') 12062 - 12064 (2') 11888 - 11890 (2')
12606 - 12609 (3') 12056 - 12058 (2') 11884 - 11886 (2')
12416 - 12418 (2') 12023 - 12025 (2') 11880 - 11882 (2')
12362 - 12364 (2') 11997 - 11999 (2') 11871 - 11873 (2')
12354 - 12358 (4') 11962 - 11964 (2') 11865 - 11867 (2')
12342 - 12345 (3') 11957 - 11959 (2') 11837 - 11840 (3')
12336 - 12338 (2') 11953 - 11955 (2') 11787 - 11789 (2')

222 perfs, 74 net feet, 30 intervals

5. RU hydro test unit and test tbg to 9500 psi.

6. RIH with WCS 5" TS RBP and WCS 5" HD packer. Set 5" RBP at ±12,800'.
Set 5" packer at ±12,310'. Pressure test packer and casing.

7. RU acid company. Acidize new and existing Wasatch perforations from
12,328' to 12,789' (200 perfs, 77'). Test pump lines to 9500 psi. Pump 10,000
gallons 15% HCL acid plus additives using 300 1.3 SG ball sealers for
diversion. Flush to bottom perf at 12,789'. RD acid company.

8. Equalize and release 5" packer at ±12,310'. Retrieve 5" RBP at ±12,800' and
set it at ±12,320'. Set 5" packer at ±11,450'. Pressure test packer and casing.

9. RU acid company. Acidize Wasatch perforations from 11,504' to 12,298' (344
perfs, 152'). Test pump lines to 9500 psi. Pump 17,000 gallons 15% HCL acid
plus additives using 525 1.3 SG ball sealers for diversion. Flush to bottom perf
at 12,298'. RD acid



. Page 3
HD Landy l-30AlE
May 16, 2007

10. Equalize and release 5" packer at ±11,450'. Retrieve 5" RBP at ±12,320' and
POOH.

11. Run production tubing and equipment and set 5" TAC at ±11,446'. Land tubing
and ND BOP. Run 1.25" pump and rods and return well to production.



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

Fee

SUNDRY NOTICE AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INIDAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom hole depth, reenter plugged 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

wells, orto drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for such proposals CRI157
1. TYPE OF WELLS 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER

[x] OilWell [ ] GasWell [ ] Other HD Landy 1-30A1E
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR 9. API NUMBER:

Flying J Oil& Gas Inc 43-047-30790
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELD ANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT

PO Drawer 130 Roosevelt, Ut 84066 435-722-5166 Bluebell
4. LOCATION OF WELLS

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 1525' FNL 2037' FWL COUNTY: Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: Sec 30 T1S R1E STATE: UTAH

11 CHECK APPROPRI \TE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

[ ] NOTICE OF INTENT [x ] ACIDIZE [ ] DEEPEN [x) REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(submitin Duplicate) [ ] ALTER CASING [ ] FRACTURE TREAT [ ] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start [ ] CASINGREPAIR [ ] NEW CONSTRUCTION [ ] TEMPORARILY ABANDON

[ ] CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [ ] OPERATOR CHANGE [ ] TUBING REPAIR

[ ] CHANGE TUBING [ ] PLUGAND ABANDON [ ] VENT OR FLARE

[x ] SUBSEQUENT REPORT [ ] CHANGE WELL NAME ( ] PLUGBACK [ ] WATER DISPOSAL

(Submit Original Form Only) [ ] CHANGE WELL STATUS [ ] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [ ] WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion: [ ] COMMINGLE PRODUCINGFORMATIONS ( ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE [ ] OTHER

6/7/07 [ ] CONVERTWELL TYPE [ ] RECOMPLETE-DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS, Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

5/21/2007 MIRUSU.RU to pull rods
5/22/2007 ND well head, NU BOP, POOH with production string
5/23/2007 TlH with 4 1/2 mill& 5" csg scraper, clean out to CIBP @12,450'.
5/24/2007 Millout CIBP @12,450,tag fillat 12,864'.
5/29/2007 Perforate Wasatch formation 11,78T - 12,72T, using 3 3/8" expendable guns, .43" holes

3 SPF, 120 degrees phasing. 216 perfs, 72 net feet, 29 intervals
5/30/2007 Hydro test tubing
6/1/2007 Acidized Wasatch perfs new & old 12,342' - 12,789', 194 holes, 75', with 10,730 gallons

15% HCL with additives. Acidized Wasatch perfs old and new, 11,504' - 12,298', 344 holes, 152' with
17,350 gallons 15% HCL with additives.

6/2/2007 Swab all perfs.
6/4/2007 POOH withwork string
6/5/2007 TIH with 2 7/8" production tubing
6/7/2007 Pick up and prime 1 1/4" RHBC pump w/15' x 1' dip tube. TlH with rods. Seat pump.

Return well to production.

SNAME(PI EASE PRINT) G TDÀTLE Workover20Foreman

(This space for State use only)

RECE1VED

JUN252007

(5/2000) DN.OFOIL,GAS&



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. DJJ

i¯CÏ5W¯¯

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 1/1/2010

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N8080-Flying J Oil & Gas, Inc. N3065-El Paso E&P Company, LP

333 West Center Street 1099 18th Street, Suite 1900
North Salt Lake, UT 84054 Denver, CO 80202

Phone: 1 (801) 296-7726 Phone: 1 (303) 291-6400

CA No. Unit:
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL

NO TYPE TYPE STATUS
SEE ATTACHED LIST

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 1/13/2010
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 1/13/2010
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 2/24/2010
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 2114377-0181
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: 8/10/2009 *

5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 2/22/2010
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM not yet BIA not yet
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: n/a
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 2/8/2010
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 2/24/2010
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 2/24/2010
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 2/24/2010
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 2/24/2010
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 2/24/2010
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: *

BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: WYB3457
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: RLB0009692
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JUO708
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: not yet
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 2/25/2010
COMMENTS: * Due to Flying J's bankruptcy, these items are being accepted as is.

El Paso (Flying J) FORM A.xis



STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

See Attachment
SUNDRY NOTICE AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

See Attachment
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells. significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-holedepth, reenter plugged 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

wells, or to drillhorizontallaterals. LJse APPLICATlONFOR PERMIT TO DRILL formfor such proposals See Attach ment
1. TYPE OF WELLS 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER

D(1Oil Well [ ] Gas Well [ ] Other See Attachment
2. NAME OF OPERATOR 9. API NUMBER:

El Paso E&P Company, L.P. See Attachment
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

1099 18th Street, Suite 1900, Denver, CO 80202 303-291-6400 See Attachment
4. LOCATION OF WELLS

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See Attachment COUNTY: Duchesne &Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE: UTAH

11 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

[ ] NOTICE OF INTENT [ ] ACIDIZE [ ] DEEPEN [ ] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(submitin Duplicate) [ ] ALTER CASING [ ] FRACTURE TREAT ( ] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximatedateworkwillstart [ ] CASING REPAIR [ ] NEW CONSTRUCTION [ ] TEMPORARILYABANDON
[ ] CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [ ] OPERATOR CHANGE [ ] TUBING REPAIR

[ ] CHANGE TUBING [ ] PLUG AND ABANDON [ ] VENT OR FLARE
( ] SUBSEQUENT REPORT [ ] CHANGE WELL NAME [ ] PLUG BACK ( ] WATER DISPOSAL

(Submit Original Form Only) [ ] CHANGE WELL STATUS [ ] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [ ] WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion: [ ] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE [X ] OTHER

[ ] CONVERT WELL TYPE [ ] RECOMPLETE-DIFFERENT FORMATION Change of Operator

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS, Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective January 1, 2010, operations of the wells on the attached exhibit were taken over by:
El Paso E&P Company, L.P., a Delaware limited partnership
1099 18th Street, Suite 1900
Denver, CO 80202

The previous operator was: FLYlNGJ OIL &GAS INC. By:
333 WEST CENTER STREET Chris J. Malan
NORTH SALT LAKE, UT 84054 Executive Vice President

Effective January 1, 2010, El Paso E&P Company, L.P. is responsible under the terms and
conditions of the leases for operations conducted on the leased lands or a portion thereofunder Utah Department of
Natural Resources Bond 400JUO708 issued by Travelers Casualty and Surety

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Mary Sharon Balakas TITLE Attorney in Fact

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED Ë/ /20/0 RECEIVED

(5/2000)
JAN13 2010

Division of Oil,GasandMining
Earlene Russell, Engineering Technician DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



Flying J Oil Gas Inc (N8080) to El Paso E1 Company LP (N3065)

well_name sec twp rng api entity Lease well stat flag
GOVT 4-14 14 060S 200E 4304730155 760 Federal OW S
GOVERNMENT 10-14 14 060S 200E 4304732709 12009 Federal OW S
GOVERNMENT 12-14 14 060S 200E 4304732850 12150 Federal OW P

MAXIMILLIAN-UTE14-1 14 010S 030W 4301330726 8437 Indian OW P
FRED BASSETT 1-22A1 22 010S 010W 4301330781 9460 Indian OW P
THE PERFECT "10" 1-10A1 10 010S 010W 4301330935 9461 Indian OW P
BADGER-SAM HU MONGUS 1-15A1 15 010S 010W 4301330949 9462 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-35A1E 35 010S 010E 4304730286 795 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-27A1E 27 010S 010E 4304730421 800 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-22A1E 22 010S 010E 4304730429 810 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-15A1E 15 010S 010E 4304730820 850 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304730829 860 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-29A1E 29 010S 010E 4304730937 895 Indian OW P
CARSON 2-36A1 36 010S 010W 4304731407 737 Indian OW P
UTE 2-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304737831 16709 Indian OW P

SADIE BLANK 1-33Z1 33 010N 010W 4301330355 765 Fee OW P
HOUSTON 1-34Z1 34 010N 010W 4301330566 885 Fee OW P
WISSE 1-28Z1 28 010N 010W 4301330609 905 Fee OW P
POWELL 1-21B1 21 020S 010W 4301330621 910 Fee OW P
H MARTIN 1-21Z1 21 010N 010W 4301330707 925 Fee OW P
BIRCHELL 1-27A1 27 010S 010W 4301330758 940 Fee OW P
EULA-UTE 1-16A1 16 010S 010W 4301330782 8443 Fee OW P
R HOUSTON 1-22Z1 22 010N 010W 4301330884 936 Fee OW P
BADGER MR BOOM BOOM 2-29A1 29 010S 010W 4301331013 9463 Fee OW P
REARY 2-17A3 17 010S 030W 4301331318 11251 Fee OW P
MAGDALENE PAPADOPULOS 1-34A1E 34 010S 010E 4304730241 785 Fee OW P
DAVIS 1-33A1E 33 010S 010E 4304730384 805 Fee WD A
LARSEN 1-25A1 25 010S 010W 4304730552 815 Fee OW TA
DRY GULCH 1-36A1 36 010S 010W 4304730569 820 Fee OW TA
NELSON 1-31A1E 31 010S 010E 4304730671 830 Fee OW P
ROSEMARY LLOYD 1-24A1E 24 010S 010E 4304730707 840 Fee OW P
HD LANDY1-30A1E 30 010S 010E 4304730790 845 Fee OW P
WALKER 1-14A1E 14 010S 010E 4304730805 855 Fee OW P
BOLTON 2-29A1E 29 010S 010E 4304731112 900 Fee OW P
PRESCOTT 1-35Z1 35 010N 010W 4304731173 1425 Fee OW P
BISEL GURR 11-1 11 010S 010W 4304731213 8438 Fee OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-22A1E 22 010S 010E 4304731265 915 Fee OW P
L. BOLTON 1-12A1 12 010S 010W 4304731295 920 Fee OW P
FOWLES 1-26A1 26 010S 010W 4304731296 930 Fee OW P
BRADLEY23-1 23 010S 010W 4304731297 8435 Fee OW P
BASTIAN 1-2A1 02 010S 010W 4304731373 736 Fee OW P
DR LONG 2-19A1E 19 010S 010E 4304731470 9505 Fee OW P
O MOON 2-26Z1 26 010N 010W 4304731480 10135 Fee OW P
LILAD 2-25A1 25 010S 010W 4304731797 10790 Fee OW P
LANDY2-30A1E 30 010S 010E 4304731895 11127 Fee OW P
BISEL-GURR 2-11A1 11 010S 010W 4304735410 14428 Fee OW P
KNIGHT 16-30 30 030S 020E 4304738499 16466 Fee OW P
ELlASON 6-30 30 030S 020E 4304738500 16465 Fee OW S



Flying J Oil Gas Inc (N8080) to El Paso E2 Company LP (N3065)

well_name sec twp rng api entity Lease well stat flag
KNIGHT 14-30 30 030S 020E 4304738501 15848 Fee OW P
FLYlNG J FEE 2-12A1 12 010S 010W 4304739467 16686 Fee OW P
OBERHANSLY 3-11A1 11 010S 010W 4304739679 Fee OW APD
BISEL GURR 4-11A1 11 010S 010W 4304739961 16791 Fee OW P
ULT 4-31 31 030S 020E 4304740017 16985 Fee OW P
DEEP CREEK 2-31 31 030S 020E 4304740026 16950 Fee OW P
DEEP CREEK 8-31 31 030S 020E 4304740032 17053 Fee OW P
ULT 6-31 31 030S 020E 4304740033 Fee OW APD
ULT 12-29 29 030S 020E 4304740039 17010 Fee OW P
ELIASON 12-30 30 030S 020E 4304740040 _ 17011 Fee OW P C
OBERHANSLY 2-2A1 02 010S 010W 4304740164 Fee OW APD
KILLIAN3-12A1 12 010S 010W 4304740226 State OW APD



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 H D LANDY 1-30A1E 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43047307900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 BLUEBELL 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1525 FNL 2037 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SENW Section: 30 Township: 01.0S Range: 01.0E Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

8/1/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 See attached procedure.  

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038

TITLE
 Sr. Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 7/22/2011

08/02/2011

Jul. 22, 2011

Sundry Number: 16888 API Well Number: 43047307900000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well HD LANDY 1-30A1E

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
ELPASOE&PCOMPANY,LP 43047307900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 E×t BLUEBELL

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

1525 FNL 2037 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: SENW Section: 30 Township: 01.05 Range: 01.0E Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

8/1/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

See attached procedure.

Approved by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: 08/02/2 1

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Sr. Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



Landy 1-30A1E 
4304730790 

SENW, S30, T1S, R1E 
 

 
• POOH with rods and tubing. 
 
• Set retrievable plug at 10200’ with 10’ of sand on top. 

 
• Perforate the following intervals: 

 

8868-8888’ 
8971-8976’ 
8982- 8985’ 
8992-8996’ 
9016-9020’ 
9038-9050’ 
9054-9058’ 
9088-9094’ 
9108-9114’ 
9138-9144’ 
9147-9150’ 
9188-9192’ 
 

 

9203-9210’ 
9220-9224’ 
9246-9256’ 
9446-9450’ 
9510-9514’ 
9521-9524’ 
9543-9546’ 
9556-9560’ 
9567-9570’ 
9580-9584’ 
9587-9589’ 
9593-9596’ 

 

9630-9634’ 
9647-9650’ 
9662-9666’ 
9732-9735’ 
9742-9748’ 
9759-9762’ 
9773-9776’ 
9792-9800’ 
9808-9812’ 
9834-9842’ 
9850-9854’ 
9880-9882’ 

9887-9892’ 
9902-9908’ 
9913-9916’ 
9920-9926’ 
9953-9956’ 
9979-9982’ 

10,002-10,010’ 
10,017-10,020’ 
10,027-10,030’ 
10,052-10,072’ 
10,111-10,116’ 
10,138-10,142’ 

 

 
• Acidize perfs in 3 stages with approximate 45,000 gallons of 15% HCL 

utilizing Brown Bio-balls (two per perforation) for diversion. 
 

• Remove plug at 10,200’, commingle Wasatch & Lower Green River. 
 
• Run tubing, pump and rods, put well on production. 

 

Jul. 22, 2011

Sundry Number: 16888 API Well Number: 43047307900000

Landy 1-30A1E
4304730790

SENW, S30, T1S, R1E

• POOH with rods and tubing.

• Set retrievable plug at 10200' with 10' of sand on top.

• Perforate the following intervals:

8868-8888' 9203-9210' 9630-9634' 9887-9892'
8971-8976' 9220-9224' 9647-9650' 9902-9908'
8982- 8985' 9246-9256' 9662-9666' 9913-9916'
8992-8996' 9446-9450' 9732-9735' 9920-9926'
9016-9020' 9510-9514' 9742-9748' 9953-9956'
9038-9050' 9521-9524' 9759-9762' 9979-9982'
9054-9058' 9543-9546' 9773-9776' 10,002-10,010'
9088-9094' 9556-9560' 9792-9800' 10,017-10,020'
9108-9114' 9567-9570' 9808-9812' 10,027-10,030'
9138-9144' 9580-9584' 9834-9842' 10,052-10,072'
9147-9150' 9587-9589' 9850-9854' 10,111-10,116'
9188-9192' 9593-9596' 9880-9882' 10,138-10,142'

• Acidize perfs in 3 stages with approximate 45,000 gallons of 15% HCL
utilizing Brown Bio-balls (two per perforation) for diversion.

• Remove plug at 10,200', commingle Wasatch & Lower Green River.

• Run tubing, pump and rods, put well on



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 H D LANDY 1-30A1E 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43047307900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 BLUEBELL 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1525 FNL 2037 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SENW Section: 30 Township: 01.0S Range: 01.0E Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

9/24/2011

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Perforated from 10142' - 8864' and acidized. See attached operations
summary for more detail.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038

TITLE
 Sr. Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 10/12/2011

10/26/2011

Oct. 12, 2011

Sundry Number: 19416 API Well Number: 43047307900000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well HD LANDY 1-30A1E

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
ELPASOE&PCOMPANY,LP 43047307900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 E×t BLUEBELL

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

1525 FNL 2037 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: SENW Section: 30 Township: 01.05 Range: 01.0E Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

9/24/2011 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR RErt
D e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Perforated from 10142' - 8864' and acidized. See attached operations
summary for more detail.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Sr. Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



WESTERN

1       General

1.1       Customer Information

WESTERNCompany

Representative

Address

1.2       Well Information

LANDY 1-30A1EWell

LANDY 1-30A1ESiteALTAMONT FIELDProject

Event RECOMPLETE LANDPEAK/700 *Rig Name/No.

Start Date 9/16/2011 End Date

9/4/1980Spud Date UWI 030-001-S 001-E 30

Active Datum GROUND LEVEL @5,421.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)

Afe 

No./Description

154737/42956 / 

2       Summary

2.1       Operation Summary

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

9/16/2011 10:30 11:00 0.50 MIRU 01 P MOVE RIG FROM HORROCKS 2-20A1E TO LOCATION

11:00 12:30 1.50 MIRU 01 P SPOT IN, RIG UP,LAY DOWN HORSESHEAD WHILE HOT OIL 

TRUCK PUMPED 60 BBLS 2% KCL DOWN B/S

12:30 13:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P UNSEAT ROD PUMP AT 12,481' AQND FLUSH WITH 60 BBLS 2%

13:30 17:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 PULL OUT OF HOLE WITH 128 1" SLICK RODS (LAYED DOWN 

TOP 21),144 7/8" SLICK RODS (LAUED DOWN TOP 33 ), 214- 

3/4" SLICK RODS( LAYED DOWN TOP34) LAY DOWN 10 

WEIGHT BARS AND A 2" X 1 1/4" X 28' PUMP. FLUSH RODS 

TWICE WHILE PULLING OUT OF HOLE

17:00 19:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 16 P NIPPLE DOWN WELLHEAD, NIPPLE UP BOP'S, RIG UP RIG FOR 

TUBING, TRY TO RELEASE TUBING ANCHOR CATCHER, TAC 

RELEASED BUT WAS HANGING UP WHILE GOING UP OF DOWN 

TRIED TO WORK FREE FOR 1 HOUR. LAYED DOWN 1 JOINT OF 

2 7/8" EUE TUBING AND SHUT WELL IN FOR NIGHT

9/17/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING (WORKING AROUND ACID 

AND SCANNING TUBING

 7:30  9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 18 P PUMP DOWN TUBING 1 BBL PARRIFIN SOLVENT 5 BBL PAD 2% 

KCL, 1 BBL SCALE INHIBATOR, 5 BBL PAD, 2000 GALLONS 

15% HYDROCLORIC ACID, AND FLUSH WITH 70 BBLS 2% KCL

 9:30 10:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P TRY TO RELEASE ANCHOR WITH TONGS WITH OUT SUCCUSS

10:30 11:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P RIG UP POWER SWIVEL

11:00 11:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P RELEASE TUBING ANCHOR AND WORK ANCHOR FREE

11:30 12:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 RIG DOWN POWER SWIVEL AND RIG UP PIPE RENEWAL 

SERVICES

12:00 17:00 5.00 PRDHEQ 39 P PULL OUT OF HOLE SCANNING 321 JOINTS 2 7/8" EUE TUBING 

LAYED DOWN 8 BAD CHANGE OVER TO 2 3/8" EQUIPMENT 

AND STAND 8 JOINTS 2 3/8" BACK IN DERRICK. LAYED DOWN 

73 JOINTS OF 2 3/8" TUBING ON TRAILER TO BE REMOVED 

FROM PRODUCTION STRING RERUN.

17:00 19:30 2.50 WLWORK 18 P RIG UP WIRE LINE TRUCK AND MAKE A     4.015" GAUGE RING

RUN TO 10,300' PULL OUT OF HOLE. SHUT WELL IN FOR NIGHT. 

TURN CASING TO TREATOR

9/18/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 WLWORK 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING (WORKING SAFELY 

AROUND WIRELINE)

 1October 11, 2011 at 10:58 am OpenWells  Oct. 12, 2011

Sundry Number: 19416 API Well Number: 43047307900000

WESTERN

1 General

1.1 Customer Information

Companv WESTERN

Representative
Address

1.2 Well Information

Well LANDY 1-30A1E

Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site LANDY 1-30A1E

Rig Name/No. PEAK/700 * Event RECOMPLETE LAND

Start Date 9/16/2011 End Date
Spud Date 9/4/1980 UWI 030-001-5 001-E 30

Active Datum GROUND LEVEL @5,421.Oft (above Mean Sea Level)

Afe 154737/42956 /
No.lDescription

2 Summary

2.1 Operation Summary

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
9/16/2011 10:30 11:00 0.50 MIRU 01 P MOVE RIG FROM HORROCKS 2-20A1E TO LOCATION

11:00 12:30 1.50 MIRU 01 P SPOT IN, RIG UP,LAY DOWN HORSESHEAD WHILE HOT OIL
TRUCK PUMPED 60 BBLS 2% KCL DOWN B/S

12:30 13:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P UNSEAT ROD PUMP AT 12,481' AQND FLUSH WITH 60 BBLS 2%
13:30 17:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 PULL OUT OF HOLE WITH 128 1" SLICK RODS (LAYED DOWN

TOP 21),144 7/8" SLICK RODS (LAUED DOWN TOP 33 ),214-

3/4" SLICK RODS( LAYED DOWN TOP34) LAY DOWN 10
WEIGHT BARS AND A 2" X 1 1/4" X 28' PUMP. FLUSH RODS
TWICE WHILE PULLING OUT OF HOLE

17:00 19:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 16 P NIPPLE DOWN WELLHEAD, NIPPLE UP BOP'S, RIG UP RIG FOR
TUBING, TRY TO RELEASE TUBING ANCHOR CATCHER, TAC
RELEASED BUT WAS HANGING UP WHILE GOING UP OF DOWN
TRIED TO WORK FREE FOR 1 HOUR. LAYED DOWN 1 JOINT OF
2 7/8" EUE TUBING AND SHUT WELL IN FOR NIGHT

9/17/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING (WORKING AROUND ACID
AND SCANNING TUBING

7:30 9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 18 P PUMP DOWN TUBING 1 BBL PARRIFIN SOLVENT 5 BBL PAD 2%
KCL, 1 BBL SCALE INHIBATOR, 5 BBL PAD, 2000 GALLONS
15% HYDROCLORICACID, AND FLUSH WITH 70 BBLS 2% KCL

9:30 10:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P TRY TO RELEASE ANCHOR WITH TONGS WITH OUT SUCCUSS
10:30 11:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P RIG UP POWER SWIVEL
11:00 11:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P RELEASE TUBING ANCHOR AND WORK ANCHOR FREE
11:30 12:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 RIG DOWN POWER SWIVEL AND RIG UP PIPE RENEWAL

SERVICES
12:00 17:00 5.00 PRDHEQ 39 P PULL OUT OF HOLE SCANNING 321 JOINTS 2 7/8" EUE TUBING

LAYED DOWN 8 BAD CHANGE OVER TO 2 3/8" EQUIPMENT
AND STAND 8 JOINTS 2 3/8" BACK IN DERRICK. LAYED DOWN
73 JOINTS OF 2 3/8" TUBING ON TRAILER TO BE REMOVED
FROM PRODUCTION STRING RERUN.

17:00 19:30 2.50 WLWORK 18 P RIG UP WIRE LINE TRUCK AND MAKE A 4.015" GAUGE RING
RUN TO 10,300' PULL OUT OF HOLE. SHUT WELL IN FOR NIGHT.
TURN CASING TO TREATOR

9/18/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 WLWORK 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING (WORKING SAFELY
AROUND WIRELINE)
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Phase Activit
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(ft)

Operation

 7:30 16:30 9.00 WLWORK 21 P RIG UP, RUN 7" GAUGE RIG, RUN, GR LOG AND MAKE 9 

PERFORATING RUNS SHOOTING FROM 10,142' UPTO 8864' 

WITH 243' OF PERFS AND 729 SHOTS IN 120 DEGREE PHASING 

WITH 3 SHOTS PER FOOT. MAKE TOTAL OF 11 RUNS

16:30 17:00 0.50 WLWORK 18 P RIG DOWN WIRLINE TRUCK ANDTURN WELL TO  TREATOR

9/19/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 STG01 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING (TRIPPING TUBING AND 

PICKING UP TOOLS)

 7:30 11:30 4.00 STG01 39 P PICK UP 5" RETRIEVIABLE bRIDGE PLUG, RETRIEVING TOOL, 4' 

SUB, 5" PACKER, 1JT 2 3/8" N80 EUE TUBING, +45 SEAT NIPPLE, 

3 JTS 2 3/8" N80 EUE TUBING, 2 3/8" X 2 7/8" XOVER AND TRIP 

IN HOLE WITH 272 JTS TUBING OUT OF DERRICK, P/U 8 JOINTS 

OFF FLOAT.

11:30 12:30 1.00 STG01 18 P SET PLUG @ 10,176' AND PLUG AT 10,040' TO ACIDIZEPERF 

BETWEEN 10,052 AND 10,142'

12:30 12:30 0.00 STG01 18 P SHUT DOWN FOR DAY

9/20/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 STG01 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFTEY MEETING (PUMPING ACID UNDER 

PRESSURE)

 7:30 10:30 3.00 STG01 18 P RIG UP FRAC EQUIPMENT, AND PRESSURE TEST LINES TO 9000 

PSI. FILL BACKSIDE WITH 254 BBLS 2% KCL

10:30 11:30 1.00 STG01 35 P START ACID JOB AND FILL TUBING WITH 46 BBLS 2% KCL 

PUMPING AT 11 BBLS A MINUTE. BREAK DOWN PERFERATIONS 

@ 5,359 PSI WITH  10 BBLS @ 6 BBLS A MINUTE. STAGE TO 

ACID AND PUMP 5,166 GAQLLONS 15% HCL AT 11 BBLS A 

MINUTE AND AVERAGE TREATING PRESSURE OF 7,100 PSI, 

PUMP 5,502 GALLONS 15% HCL DROPPING 87 BIO BALLS AT 

AVERAGE OF 10 BBLS MIN AND 6700 PSI. FLUSH TUBING WITH 

76 BBLS 2% KCA AND SHUT DOWN. ISIPM @ 6211, 5 MIN 

@3152, 10 MIN @3123, 15 MINUTE @3093. SHUT WELL IN

11:30 12:30 1.00 STG01 19 P RIG DOWN FRAC TECH AND RIG UP FLOW BACK LINE

12:30 14:30 2.00 FB 19 P OPEN WELL WITH 3200 PSI ON A 12/64 CHOKE  AND BLEED 

DOWN TO FLOW BACK TANK FLOWING BACK 76 BBLS FRAC 

FLUID

14:30 15:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 15 P RELEASE 5" PACKER AND PLUG CIRCULATING 100 BBLS TO 

KILL WELL.

15:30 16:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 27 P SET 5" PLUG @ 10,040'

16:00 23:00 7.00 PRDHEQ 39 P PULL OUT OF HOLE WITH 5" PACKER AND RETREIVING HEAD 

LAYING DOWN PACKER AND 6 JOINTS 2 3/8" TUBING. PICK UP 

5" RETREIVING HEAD 2 JOINTS 2 3/8" TUBING 2 3/8" X 2 7/8" 

CHANGE OVER, 7" PACKER 2 JOINTS 2 7/8" TUBING, +45 SEAT 

NIPPLE AND TRIP IN HOLE WITH 315 JOINTS 2 7/8" TOTAL 

SETTING PACKER @ 9,763' IN 25,000 PSI COMPRESSION.

SHUT WELL IN WITH FRAC VALVE

9/21/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 STG02 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING (SLIPS,TRIPS AND FALLS)

 7:30  8:30 1.00 STG02 16 P RIG UP FRAC CREW. FILL BACK SIDE WITH 85 BBLS AND HOLD 

PRESSURE THROUGH FRAC. PRESSURE TEST PUMP LINES TO 

9,500PSI
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2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)

7:30 16:30 9.00 WLWORK 21 P RIG UP, RUN 7" GAUGE RIG, RUN, GR LOG AND MAKE 9
PERFORATING RUNS SHOOTING FROM 10,142' UPTO 8864'
WITH 243' OF PERFS AND 729 SHOTS IN 120 DEGREE PHASING
WITH 3 SHOTS PER FOOT. MAKE TOTAL OF 11 RUNS

16:30 17:00 0.50 WLWORK 18 P RIG DOWN WIRLINE TRUCK ANDTURN WELL TO TREATOR

9/19/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 STGO1 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING (TRIPPING TUBING AND
PICKING UP TOOLS)

7:30 11:30 4.00 STGO1 39 P PICK UP 5" RETRIEVIABLE bRIDGE PLUG, RETRIEVING TOOL, 4'
SUB, 5" PACKER, 1JT 2 3/8" N80 EUE TUBING, +45 SEAT NIPPLE,
3 JTS 2 3/8" N80 EUE TUBING, 2 3/8"X 2 7/8"XOVER AND TRIP
IN HOLE WITH 272 JTS TUBING OUT OF DERRICK, P/U 8 JOINTS
OFF FLOAT.

11:30 12:30 1.00 STGO1 18 P SET PLUG @ 10,176' AND PLUG AT 10,040' TO ACIDIZEPERF
BETWEEN 10,052 AND 10,142'

12:30 12:30 0.00 STGO1 18 P SHUT DOWN FOR DAY

9/20/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 STGO1 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFTEY MEETING (PUMPING ACID UNDER
PRESSURE)

7:30 10:30 3.00 STGO1 18 P RIG UP FRAC EQUIPMENT, AND PRESSURE TEST LINES TO 9000
PSI. FILL BACKSIDE WITH 254 BBLS 2% KCL

10:30 11:30 1.00 STG01 35 P START ACID JOB AND FILL TUBING WITH 46 BBLS 2% KCL
PUMPING AT 11 BBLS A MINUTE. BREAK DOWN PERFERATIONS

@ 5,359 PSI WITH 10 BBLS @ 6 BBLS A MINUTE. STAGE TO
ACID AND PUMP 5,166 GAQLLONS 15% HCL AT 11 BBLS A
MINUTE AND AVERAGE TREATING PRESSURE OF 7,100 PSI,
PUMP 5,502 GALLONS 15% HCL DROPPING 87 BIO BALLS AT
AVERAGE OF 10 BBLS MIN AND 6700 PSI. FLUSH TUBING WITH
76 BBLS 2% KCA AND SHUT DOWN. ISIPM @ 6211, 5 MIN
@3152,10 MIN @3123,15 MINUTE @3093.SHUT WELL IN

11:30 12:30 1.00 STGO1 19 P RIG DOWN FRAC TECH AND RIG UP FLOW BACK LINE
12:30 14:30 2.00 FB 19 P OPEN WELL WITH 3200 PSI ON A 12/64 CHOKE AND BLEED

DOWN TO FLOW BACK TANK FLOWING BACK 76 BBLS FRAC
FLUID

14:30 15:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 15 P RELEASE 5" PACKER AND PLUG CIRCULATING 100 BBLS TO
KILLWELL.

15:30 16:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 27 P SET 5" PLUG @ 10,040'
16:00 23:00 7.00 PRDHEQ 39 P PULL OUT OF HOLE WITH 5" PACKER AND RETREIVING HEAD

LAYING DOWN PACKER AND 6 JOINTS 2 3/8" TUBING. PICK UP
5" RETREIVING HEAD 2 JOINTS 2 3/8" TUBING 2 3/8" X 2 7/8"
CHANGE OVER, 7" PACKER 2 JOINTS 2 7/8" TUBING, +45 SEAT
NIPPLE AND TRIP IN HOLE WITH 315 JOINTS 2 7/8" TOTAL
SETTING PACKER @ 9,763' IN 25,000 PSI COMPRESSION.
SHUT WELL IN WITH FRAC VALVE

9/21/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 STGO2 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING (SLIPS,TRIPS AND FALLS)
7:30 8:30 1.00 STGO2 16 P RIG UP FRAC CREW. FILL BACK SIDE WITH 85 BBLS AND HOLD

PRESSURE THROUGH FRAC. PRESSURE TEST PUMP LINES TO
9,500PSI

October 11, 2011 at 10:58 am 2
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 8:30  9:30 1.00 STG02 35 P FRAC PERF ZONE NUMBER 2. PERFS FROM 9759' TO  10010' 

FOR A TOTAL OF 198 HOLES.   FILL TUBING WITH 28 BBLS @ 

7.7 BBLS A MINUTE, PRESSURE BROKE AT 6925 PSI. INCREASE 

RATE TO 10.3 BBLS A MINUTE AND PUMP 4116 GALLONS 15% 

KCL, DROPPED 198 BIO SEALERS IN NEXT 6,132 GALLONS AND 

FOLLOW WITH 2,100 GALLONS ACID. FLUSH TUBING WITH 68 

BBLS AND SHUT IN.

AVERAGE RATE 10.9 BBLS MINUTE WITH TREATING PRESSURE 

AT 7045PSI. INSTANT SHUT DOWN PRESSURE @ 1859 PSI. 5 

MINUTE PRESSURE 874, 10 MIN PRESSURE 164 PSI, 15 MINUTE 

PRESSURE 0 FRAC GRAIDENT 0.85

 9:30 10:30 1.00 STG02 16 P RIG DOWM  FRAC CREW

10:30 12:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RELEASE PACKER TRIP IN HOLE WITH TUBING AND ENGAGE 

PLUG. CIRCULATE TOP OF PLUG CLEAN WITH 75 BBLS 2% KCL 

RELEASE PLUG. TRY TO FLUSH TUBING WITH UP TO 3000 PSI. 

PULL 27 JOINTS WET TUBING AND FRAC FLUID STARTED TO 

HAVE STRONG ACID PRESENCE. SHUT DOWN AND ORDER 

TRUCK TO PERFORATE TUBING.

12:30 14:30 2.00 WLWORK 42 N WAIT FOR WIRLINE TRUCK

14:30 16:30 2.00 WLWORK 21 N RIG UP WIRELINE TRUCK AND TRIP IN HOLE WITH TOOLS AND 

SHOOT 3 HOLES IN 4' 2 3/8" SUB AT BRIDGE PLUG RETREIVING 

TOOL. TUBING WENT ON VACUM. PULL OUT OF HOLE PUMP 40 

BBLS DOWN TUBING. RIG DOWN WIRELINE TRUCK

16:30 19:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P PULL OUT OF HOLE WITH  242 TOTAL JOINTS OF TUBING. END 

OF TUBING @ 1683' SHUT DOWN FOR NIGHT

9/22/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 STG03 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING, (TRIPPING PIPE RIGGING UP 

FRAC CREW)

 7:30  8:30 1.00 STG03 39 P PULL OUT OF HOLE WITH 1600' KILL STRING AND LAY DOWN 

TOOLS. PICK UP 7" PLUG AND pACKER

 8:30 11:00 2.50 STG03 39 P TRIP IN HOLE AND SET PLUG @9,120' AND PACKER @8796'

11:00 12:00 1.00 STG03 16 P RIG UP FRAC TEC WHILE FILLING CASING WITH 22O BBLS 2% 

KCL PRESSURE TEST TO 500 PSI TEST GOOD.

12:00 12:30 0.50 STG03 28 P FRAC TECH PRE PUMP SAFETY MEETING

12:30 13:00 0.50 STG03 35 P FILL TUBING WITH 10 BBLS 2% @ 7BBLS MINUTE. BREAK 

DOWN FORMATION WITH 4 BBLS @ 6374. PUMP 10000 ACIC 

AND BALLS AT UP TO 7146 LBS AND PUMP 10080 GALLONS 

15% HCL ACID AND BACK SIDE PRESSURE STARTED TO RISE 

SHUT ACID  JOB DOWN

13:00 14:00 1.00 STG03 19 N BLEED CASING OFF AND WATCH WELL FLOW UP BACK SIDE 

WITH OIL AND ACID WATER WHILE FLUSHING TUBING WITH 80 

BBLS 2% KCL.

14:00 15:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P RELEASE PACKER AND PULL ABOVE TOP SET OF PERFS AND 

SET PACKER @8813' FILL BACKSIDE AND TEST PACKER TO 

800 PSI TEST GOOD. OPEN PACKER BYPASS

15:00 17:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 18 P CIRCULATE 377 BBLS TO CLEAN UP WELL AND STABILIZE 

WELL BORE.

17:30 19:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P TRIP IN HOLE AND TAG BRIDGE PLUG @ 9.120' CIRCULATE TOP 

OF PLUG CLEAN WITH 80 BBLS. RELEASE PLUG .

19:00 20:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P PULL OUT OF HOLE SETTING BRIDGE PLUG @ 9120' LEAVING 

18 SHOTS OUT OF STAGE 4. SET PACKER @ 8796'

20:30 21:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P FILL BACKSIDE WITH 68 BBLS 2% AND TEST TO 800 PSI. FOR 

20 MINUTES,TEST GOOD. BLEED OFF SHUT WELL IN FOR NIGHT

9/23/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 STG04 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING, ( PUMPING ACID, HOLDING 

BACK PRESSURE)

 7:30  8:00 0.50 STG04 30 P RIG FRAC TECH UP TO TUBING AND PRESSURE TEST TO 9000 

PSI.
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2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)

8:30 9:30 1.00 STGO2 35 P FRAC PERF ZONE NUMBER 2. PERFS FROM 9759' TO 10010'
FOR A TOTAL OF 198 HOLES. FILL TUBING WITH 28 BBLS @
7.7 BBLS A MINUTE, PRESSURE BROKE AT 6925 PSI. INCREASE
RATE TO 10.3 BBLS A MINUTE AND PUMP 4116 GALLONS 15%
KCL, DROPPED 198 BIO SEALERS IN NEXT 6,132 GALLONS AND
FOLLOW WITH 2,100 GALLONS ACID. FLUSH TUBING WITH 68
BBLS AND SHUT IN.
AVERAGE RATE 10.9 BBLS MINUTE WITH TREATING PRESSURE
AT 7045PSI. INSTANT SHUT DOWN PRESSURE @ 1859 PSI. 5
MINUTE PRESSURE 874, 10 MIN PRESSURE 164 PSI, 15 MINUTE
PRESSURE O FRAC GRAIDENT 0.85

9:30 10:30 1.00 STGO2 16 P RIG DOWM FRAC CREW
10:30 12:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RELEASE PACKER TRIP IN HOLE WITH TUBING AND ENGAGE

PLUG. CIRCULATE TOP OF PLUG CLEAN WITH 75 BBLS 2% KCL
RELEASE PLUG. TRY TO FLUSH TUBING WITH UP TO 3000 PSI.
PULL 27 JOINTS WET TUBING AND FRAC FLUID STARTED TO
HAVE STRONG ACID PRESENCE. SHUT DOWN AND ORDER
TRUCK TO PERFORATE TUBING.

12:30 14:30 2.00 WLWORK 42 N WAIT FOR WIRLINE TRUCK
14:30 16:30 2.00 WLWORK 21 N RIG UP WIRELINE TRUCK AND TRIP IN HOLE WITH TOOLS AND

SHOOT 3 HOLES IN 4'2 3/8" SUB AT BRIDGE PLUG RETREIVING
TOOL. TUBING WENT ON VACUM. PULL OUT OF HOLE PUMP 40
BBLS DOWN TUBING. RIG DOWN WIRELINE TRUCK

16:30 19:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P PULL OUT OF HOLE WITH 242 TOTAL JOINTS OF TUBING. END
OF TUBING @ 1683' SHUT DOWN FOR NIGHT

9/22/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 STGO3 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING, (TRIPPING PIPE RIGGING UP
FRAC CREW)

7:30 8:30 1.00 STGO3 39 P PULL OUT OF HOLE WITH 1600' KILL STRING AND LAY DOWN
TOOLS. PICK UP 7" PLUG AND pACKER

8:30 11:00 2.50 STGO3 39 P TRIP IN HOLE AND SET PLUG @9,120'AND PACKER @8796'
11:00 12:00 1.00 STGO3 16 P RIG UP FRAC TEC WHILE FILLING CASING WITH 22O BBLS 2%

KCL PRESSURE TEST TO 500 PSI TEST GOOD.
12:00 12:30 0.50 STGO3 28 P FRAC TECH PRE PUMP SAFETY MEETING
12:30 13:00 0.50 STGO3 35 P FILL TUBING WITH 10 BBLS 2% @ 7BBLS MINUTE. BREAK

DOWN FORMATION WITH 4 BBLS @ 6374. PUMP 10000 ACIC
AND BALLS AT UP TO 7146 LBS AND PUMP 10080 GALLONS
15% HCL ACID AND BACK SIDE PRESSURE STARTED TO RISE
SHUT ACID JOB DOWN

13:00 14:00 1.00 STGO3 19 N BLEED CASING OFF AND WATCH WELL FLOW UP BACK SIDE
WITH OIL AND ACID WATER WHILE FLUSHING TUBING WITH 80
BBLS 2% KCL.

14:00 15:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P RELEASE PACKER AND PULL ABOVE TOP SET OF PERFS AND
SET PACKER @8813'FILL BACKSIDE AND TEST PACKER TO
800 PSI TEST GOOD. OPEN PACKER BYPASS

15:00 17:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 18 P CIRCULATE 377 BBLS TO CLEAN UP WELL AND STABILIZE
WELL BORE.

17:30 19:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P TRIP IN HOLE AND TAG BRIDGE PLUG @ 9.120' CIRCULATE TOP
OF PLUG CLEAN WITH 80 BBLS. RELEASE PLUG .

19:00 20:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P PULL OUT OF HOLE SETTING BRIDGE PLUG @ 9120' LEAVING
18 SHOTS OUT OF STAGE 4. SET PACKER @ 8796'

20:30 21:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P FILL BACKSIDE WITH 68 BBLS 2% AND TEST TO 800 PSI. FOR
20 MINUTES,TEST GOOD. BLEED OFF SHUT WELL IN FOR NIGHT

9/23/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 STGO4 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING, ( PUMPING ACID, HOLDING
BACK PRESSURE)

7:30 8:00 0.50 STGO4 30 P RIG FRAC TECH UP TO TUBING AND PRESSURE TEST TO 9000
PSI.
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 8:00  8:30 0.50 STG04 28 P PRE PUMP SAFETY MEETING ( BEING ALERT AND AWARE)

 8:30  9:30 1.00 STG04 35 P OPEN TUBING AND AND FILL AND BREAK DOWN FORMATION 

WITH 14 BBLS 2% KCL @7142 PSI. PUMP 19,986 GALLONS 

ACID WITH 219  BROWN BIO BALLS. MAX PRESSURE 7,142 PSI, 

AVERAGE TREATING PRESSURE @ 6,685. FLUSH ACID WITH 83 

BBLS 2% KCL. iNSTANT SHUT DOWN PRESSURE @2,920. 5 

MINUTE SHUT IN @ 2785, 10 MINUTE SHUT IN @ 2674 PSI. 15 

MINUTE SHUT IN @ 2592. AVERAGE RATE PUMPED @11.8 

BBLS MIN. MAX RATE PUMPED @ 13.8 BBLS MIN. FRAC 

GRAIDENT @.85 WITH 7,658 HP USED

 9:30 10:00 0.50 RDMO 30 P RIG DOWN FRAC CREW, RIG UP FLOW BACK EQUIPMENT

10:00 12:00 2.00 FB 17 P OPEN WELL TO FLOW BACK TANK @ 2400 PSI ON @ 12/64" 

CHOKE AND FLOW 80 BBLS FRAC FLUID BACK TO FLOW 

BACK TANK.

12:00 13:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P OPEN BYPASS ON PACKER AND CIRCULATE 80 BBLS TO 

CLEAN UP PACKER.

13:00 13:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RELEASE PACKER @ 8796 AND TRIP IN HOLE TO ENGAGE 

BRIDGE PLUG @ 9120

13:30 15:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 06 P CiRCULATE 80 BBLS TO CLEAN UP TOP OF BRIDGE PLUG

15:00 18:30 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 RELEASE BRIDGE PLUG AND PULL OUT OF HOLE WITH TOOLS 

AND 254 JOINTS TUBING. END OF TOOLS @ 1300' SHUT WELL 

IN. SHUT DOWN FOR NIGHT

9/24/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING, (LAYING DOWN PACKER 

AND PLUG, HYDROTESTING) BLOW DOWN CASING (40 PSI ON 

WELL BORE)

 7:30  8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P PULL OUT OF HOLE WITH 40 JOINTS 2 7/8" TUBING, 7" PLUG 

AND PACKER. LAY DOWN TOOLS. CHANGE OVER TO 2 3/8" 

EQUIPMENT

 8:30  9:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TRIP IN HOLE WITH 2 3/8" BULL PLUG, 2 JOINTS 2 3/8 N80 EUE 

TUBING, 1-4' PERFORATED 2 3/8" SUB, + 45 SEAT NIPPLE, RIG 

UP HYDROTESTER FOR 2 3/8" TUBING

 9:30 12:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 09 N HYDROTEST TOOLS WERE NOT WORKING PROPERLY. WAIT 

ON NEW TOOLS

12:00 19:30 7.50 PRDHEQ 39 P HYDRO TEST 4 JOINTS 2 3/8" N80 EUE 5"TECH TEC TUBING 

ANCHOR CATCHER, 2 JOINTS 2 3/8" N80 EUE, 2 3/8" X 2 7/8" 

EUE CHANGE OVER, AND 322 JOINTS 2 7/8" N80 EUE TUBING 

TO 8500 PSI  FINDING NO LEAKS

19:30 20:00 0.50 RDMO 02 P RIG DOWN AND RELEASE HYDRO TEST TRUCK SHUT DOWN 

FOR DAY

9/25/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREWS TRAVEL, NIPPLE DOWN BOP'S, NIPPLE UP WELL HEAD

 7:30  8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P SET 5" TUBING ANCHOR @ 10,080' IN 25,000 LBS TESNION, 

WITH SEAT NIPPLE @ 10,202' AND END OF TUBING @ 10,270'. 

RIG DOWN FLOOR, NIPPLE DOWN BOP'S, NIPPLE UP WELL 

HEAD FLANGE AND WELL HEAD PACKAGE.

 8:30  9:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P FLUSH TUBING WITH 60 BBLS 2% KCL, PICK UP AND PRIME     

2" X 1 1/2" X 30' RHBC WEATHERFORD ROD PUMP WITH 16' DIP 

TUBE

 9:30 12:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RUN IN HOLE WITH ROD PUMP, NEW WEATHERFORD NO TAP 

TOOL 10- 1 1/2" WEIGHT BARS, 194-3/4" SLICK RODS, 110- 7/8 

SLICK RODS, 90-1" SLICK RODS SPACE OUT PUMP WITH 1-2" X 

1", 1-4' X 1", 1-6' X 1", 1-8' X 1" ROD SUBS AND PICK UP POLISH 

ROD WITH LINER AND SEAT PUMP AT 10,202' FILL AND TEST 

TUBING WITH 25 BBLS TO 1000 PSI. TEST GOOD GOOD PUMP 

ACTION. PICK UP HORSES HEAD AND HANG OFF RODS.

12:30 13:30 1.00 RDMO 02 P RIG DOWN PUMP AND RIG, MOVE OUT
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Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
8:00 8:30 0.50 STGO4 28 P PRE PUMP SAFETY MEETING ( BEING ALERT AND AWARE)
8:30 9:30 1.00 STGO4 35 P OPEN TUBING AND AND FILL AND BREAK DOWN FORMATION

WITH 14 BBLS 2% KCL @7142PSI. PUMP 19,986 GALLONS
ACID WITH 219 BROWN BIO BALLS. MAX PRESSURE 7,142 PSI,
AVERAGE TREATING PRESSURE @6,685. FLUSH ACID WITH 83
BBLS 2% KCL. iNSTANT SHUT DOWN PRESSURE @2,920.5
MINUTE SHUT IN @2785, 10 MINUTE SHUT IN @2674 PSI. 15
MINUTE SHUT IN @2592. AVERAGE RATE PUMPED @11.8
BBLS MIN. MAX RATE PUMPED @ 13.8 BBLS MIN. FRAC
GRAIDENT @.85WITH 7,658 HP USED

9:30 10:00 0.50 RDMO 30 P RIG DOWN FRAC CREW, RIG UP FLOW BACK EQUIPMENT
10:00 12:00 2.00 FB 17 P OPEN WELL TO FLOW BACK TANK @ 2400 PSI ON @ 12/64"

CHOKE AND FLOW80 BBLS FRAC FLUID BACKTO FLOW
BACK TANK.

12:00 13:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P OPEN BYPASS ON PACKER AND CIRCULATE 80 BBLS TO
CLEAN UP PACKER.

13:00 13:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RELEASE PACKER @8796 AND TRIP IN HOLE TO ENGAGE
BRIDGE PLUG @9120

13:30 15:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 06 P CiRCULATE 80 BBLS TO CLEAN UP TOP OF BRIDGE PLUG
15:00 18:30 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 RELEASE BRIDGE PLUG AND PULL OUT OF HOLE WITH TOOLS

AND 254 JOINTS TUBING. END OF TOOLS @ 1300' SHUT WELL
IN. SHUT DOWN FOR NIGHT

9/24/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING, (LAYING DOWN PACKER
AND PLUG, HYDROTESTING) BLOW DOWN CASING (40 PSI ON
WELL BORE)

7:30 8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P PULL OUT OF HOLE WITH 40 JOINTS 2 7/8" TUBING, 7" PLUG
AND PACKER. LAY DOWN TOOLS. CHANGE OVER TO 2 3/8"
EQUIPMENT

8:30 9:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TRIP IN HOLE WITH 2 3/8" BULL PLUG, 2 JOINTS 2 3/8 N80 EUE
TUBING, 1-4' PERFORATED 2 3/8" SUB, + 45 SEAT NIPPLE, RIG
UP HYDROTESTER FOR 2 3/8" TUBING

9:30 12:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 09 N HYDROTEST TOOLS WERE NOT WORKING PROPERLY. WAIT
ON NEWTOOLS

12:00 19:30 7.50 PRDHEQ 39 P HYDRO TEST 4 JOINTS 2 3/8" N80 EUE 5"TECH TEC TUBING
ANCHOR CATCHER, 2 JOINTS 2 3/8" N80 EUE, 2 3/8" X 2 7/8"
EUE CHANGE OVER, AND 322 JOINTS 2 7/8" N80 EUE TUBING
TO 8500 PSI FINDING NO LEAKS

19:30 20:00 0.50 RDMO 02 P RIG DOWN AND RELEASE HYDRO TEST TRUCK SHUT DOWN
FOR DAY

9/25/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREWS TRAVEL, NIPPLE DOWN BOP'S, NIPPLE UP WELL HEAD
7:30 8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P SET 5" TUBING ANCHOR @ 10,080' IN 25,000 LBS TESNION,

WITH SEAT NIPPLE @ 10,202' AND END OF TUBING @ 10,270'.
RIG DOWN FLOOR, NIPPLE DOWN BOP'S, NIPPLE UP WELL
HEAD FLANGE AND WELL HEAD PACKAGE.

8:30 9:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P FLUSH TUBING WITH 60 BBLS 2% KCL, PICK UP AND PRIME
2" X 1 1/2" X 30' RHBC WEATHERFORD ROD PUMP WITH 16' DIP
TUBE

9:30 12:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RUN IN HOLE WITH ROD PUMP, NEWWEATHERFORD NO TAP
TOOL 10- 1 1/2" WEIGHT BARS, 194-3/4" SLICK RODS, 110- 7/8
SLICK RODS, 90-1" SLICK RODS SPACE OUT PUMP WITH 1-2" X
1", 1-4'X 1", 1-6'X 1", 1-8'X 1" ROD SUBS AND PICK UP POLISH
ROD WITH LINER AND SEAT PUMP AT 10,202' FILL AND TEST
TUBING WITH 25 BBLS TO 1000 PSI. TEST GOOD GOOD PUMP
ACTION. PICK UP HORSES HEAD AND HANG OFF RODS.

12:30 13:30 1.00 RDMO 02 P RIG DOWN PUMP AND RIG, MOVE OUT

October 11, 2011 at 10:58 am 4



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 H D LANDY 1-30A1E 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43047307900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 BLUEBELL 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1525 FNL 2037 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SENW Section: 30 Township: 01.0S Range: 01.0E Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

11/12/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: Set Plug & Optimization

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 El Paso plans to set a retrievable bridge plug with sand on top. See attache
procedure for details.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038

TITLE
 Sr. Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 11/3/2011

11/10/2011

Nov. 03, 2011

Sundry Number: 20038 API Well Number: 43047307900000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEEEASEDESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well HD LANDY 1-30A1E

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
ELPASOE&PCOMPANY,LP 43047307900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 E×t BLUEBELL

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

1525 FNL 2037 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: SENW Section: 30 Township: 01.05 Range: 01.0E Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

11/12/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Set Plug & Optimizatior

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

El Paso plans to set a retrievable bridge plug with sand on top. See attache
procedure for details.

Approved by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: 11/10/2 1

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Sr. Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



Landy 1-30A1E Procedure Summary 

• POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing 

• Set retrievable bridge plug at 11,400’ 

• Dump 10’ sand on plug 

• RIH w/optimized BHA, tubing to optimized depth, and optimized rod string 

• Clean location and resume production 

Nov. 03, 2011

Sundry Number: 20038 API Well Number: 43047307900000

Landy 1-30A1E Procedure Summary
• POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing
• Set retrievable bridge plug at 11,400'
• Dump 10' sand on plug
• RIH w/optimized BHA, tubing to optimized depth, and optimized rod string

• Clean location and resume



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 H D LANDY 1-30A1E 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43047307900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 BLUEBELL 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1525 FNL 2037 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SENW Section: 30 Township: 01.0S Range: 01.0E Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

11/12/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: Set Plug & Optimization

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 El Paso plans to set a retrievable bridge plug with sand on top. See attache
procedure for details.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038

TITLE
 Sr. Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 11/3/2011

11/10/2011

Nov. 03, 2011

Sundry Number: 20038 API Well Number: 43047307900000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEEEASEDESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well HD LANDY 1-30A1E

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
ELPASOE&PCOMPANY,LP 43047307900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 E×t BLUEBELL

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

1525 FNL 2037 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: SENW Section: 30 Township: 01.05 Range: 01.0E Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

11/12/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Set Plug & Optimizatior

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

El Paso plans to set a retrievable bridge plug with sand on top. See attache
procedure for details.

Approved by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: 11/10/2 1

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Sr. Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



Landy 1-30A1E Procedure Summary 

• POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing 

• Set retrievable bridge plug at 11,400’ 

• Dump 10’ sand on plug 

• RIH w/optimized BHA, tubing to optimized depth, and optimized rod string 

• Clean location and resume production 

Nov. 03, 2011

Sundry Number: 20038 API Well Number: 43047307900000

Landy 1-30A1E Procedure Summary
• POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing
• Set retrievable bridge plug at 11,400'
• Dump 10' sand on plug
• RIH w/optimized BHA, tubing to optimized depth, and optimized rod string
• Clean location and resume



RECEIVED: Feb. 28, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 H D LANDY 1-30A1E 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43047307900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 BLUEBELL 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1525 FNL 2037 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SENW Section: 30 Township: 01.0S Range: 01.0E Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

1 /26 /2012

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  Set Plug & Optimization

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 See attached Operations Summary for details.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038

TITLE
 Principle Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 2 /28 /2012

March 06, 2012

Sundry Number: 23397 API Well Number: 43047307900000Sundry Number: 23397 API Well Number: 43047307900000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well HD LANDY 1-30A1E

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP 43047307900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 Ext BLUEBELL

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

1525 FNL 2037 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SENW Section: 30 Township: 01.0S Range: 01.0E Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

1/26/2012
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Set Plug & Optimization

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

See attached Operations Summary for details. Accepted by the
utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
March 06, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Principle Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 2/28/2012

RECEIVED: Feb. 28,



RECEIVED: Feb. 28, 2012

WESTERN US

1       General

1.1       Customer Information

WESTERN USCompany

Representative

Address

1.2       Well Information

LANDY 1-30A1EWell

LANDY 1-30A1ESiteALTAMONT FIELDProject

Event RECOMPLETE LANDPEAK/700 *Rig Name/No.

Start Date 1/19/2012 End Date

9/4/1980Spud Date UWI 030-001-S 001-E 30

Active Datum KB @5,435.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)

Afe 

No./Description

157299/44224 / LANDY 1-30 A1E (ORRI)

2       Summary

2.1       Operation Summary

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

1/25/2012  6:00  7:00 1.00 MIRU 28 P CT. HELD SAFETY MTNG. (RIGGING UP RIG). WRITE & REVIEW 

JSA'S.

 7:00  9:00 2.00 MIRU 01 P RIG UP W/O RIG. HOT OILER PMPING 60 BBLS HOT 2% KCL 

WTR. RD CONV P/U LD HORSES HEAD. UNSEAT PMP @10,202'. 

LD 1 1/2" X 30' PR W/ 1 3/4" X 20' LINER. 1-2',1-4',1-6', 1-8' X 1" 

PONY RODS. FLUSH RODS W/ 60 BBLS HOT 2% KCL WTR.

 9:00 12:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 90-1" EL SLK RDS. 110-7/8" EL SLK RDS. 194-3/4" EL 

SLK RDS. LD 10-1 1/2" K-BAR WEIGHT RDS. LD 2' X 1 1/2" X 28' 

RHBC INSERT PMP (WCS).

12:00 14:30 2.50 WHDTRE 16 P X-O TO TBNG EQUIP. ND C-FLANGE. NU BOPE. RELEASE 5" TAC 

@10,077'.

14:30 15:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 42-JNTS 2 7/8" N-80 EUE TBNG. SHUT DN TO TIE RIG 

BACK TO DOUBLE FAST AND FOUND BAD SPOT IN DRILLING 

LINE. DECIDED TO SHUT RIG DOWN FOR THE DAY AND CUT 

BAD SPOT OUT OF DRILL LINE, AND POUR NEW ROPE 

SOCKETT.  SECURE WELL S.D.F.D. EOT @8,957'.

PUMPED 200 BBLS 2% KCL WTR FOR THE DAY.

USED 70 GAL DIESEL FOR THE DAY.

USED 200 GAL DIESEL FOR THE DAY.

1/26/2012  6:00  7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 28 P CT. HELD SAFETY MTNG.(TRIPPING TBNG). WRITE & REVIEW 

JSA'S.

 7:00 11:00 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 280-JNTS 2 7/8" N-80 EUE TBNG. X-O 2 7/8" EUE X 2 

3/8" EUE. 2-JNTS 2 3/8" EUE. 5" SLIM HOLE TAC (TECH TAC) 

4-JNTS 2 3/8" EUE TBNG. 2 3/8" PSN. 4' X 2 3/8" PERF PUP JNT. 

2-JNTS 2 3/8" MUD JNTS 2 3/8" SOLID PLUG.

 1February 28, 2012 at  9:43 am OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 23397 API Well Number: 43047307900000Sundry Number: 23397 API Well Number: 43047307900000

WESTERN US

1 General

1.1 Customer Information

Companv WESTERN US

Representative

Address

1.2 Well Information

Well LANDY 1-30A1E

Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site LANDY 1-30A1E

Rig Name/No. PEAKl700 * Event RECOMPLETE LAND

Start Date 1/19/2012 End Date
Spud Date 9/4/1980 UWI 030-001-5 001-E 30

Active Datum KB @5,435.0ft(above Mean Sea Level)

Afe 157299/44224 / LANDY 1-30 A1E (ORRI)
No.lDescription

2 Summary

2.1 Operation Summary

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)

1/25/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 MIRU 28 P CT. HELD SAFETY MTNG. (RIGGING UP RIG). WRITE & REVIEW
JSA'S.

7:00 9:00 2.00 MIRU 01 P RIG UP W/O RIG. HOT OILER PMPING 60 BBLS HOT 2% KCL
WTR. RD CONV P/U LD HORSES HEAD. UNSEAT PMP @10,202'.
LD 1 1/2" X 30' PR W/ 1 3/4" X 20' LINER. 1-2',1-4',1-6', 1-8'X 1"
PONY RODS. FLUSH RODS W/ 60 BBLS HOT 2% KCL WTR.

9:00 12:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 90-1" EL SLK RDS. 110-7/8" EL SLK RDS. 194-3/4" EL
SLK RDS. LD 10-1 1/2" K-BAR WEIGHT RDS. LD 2'X 1 1/2"X 28'
RHBC INSERT PMP (WCS).

12:00 14:30 2.50 WHDTRE 16 P X-O TO TBNG EQUIP. ND C-FLANGE. NU BOPE. RELEASE 5" TAC
@10,077'.

14:30 15:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 42-JNTS 2 7/8" N-80 EUE TBNG. SHUT DN TO TIE RIG
BACK TO DOUBLE FAST AND FOUND BAD SPOT IN DRILLING
LINE. DECIDED TO SHUT RIG DOWN FOR THE DAY AND CUT
BAD SPOT OUT OF DRILL LINE, AND POUR NEW ROPE
SOCKETT. SECURE WELL S.D.F.D. EOT @8,957'.

PUMPED 200 BBLS 2% KCL WTR FOR THE DAY.
USED 70 GAL DIESEL FOR THE DAY.
USED 200 GAL DIESEL FOR THE DAY.

1/26/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 28 P CT. HELD SAFETY MTNG.(TRIPPING TBNG). WRITE & REVIEW
JSA'S.

7:00 11:00 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 280-JNTS 2 7/8" N-80 EUE TBNG. X-O 2 7/8" EUE X 2
3/8" EUE. 2-JNTS 2 3/8" EUE. 5" SLIM HOLE TAC (TECH TAC)
4-JNTS 2 3/8" EUE TBNG. 2 3/8" PSN. 4'X 2 3/8" PERF PUP JNT.
2-JNTS 2 3/8" MUD JNTS 2 3/8" SOLID PLUG.

February 28, 2012 at 9:43 am 1 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Feb. 28,



RECEIVED: Feb. 28, 2012

WESTERN US

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

11:00 17:30 6.50 PRDHEQ 39 P MU & RIH W/ 2 3/8" SOLID PLUG. 2- 2 3/8"  EUE MUD JNTS. 4' X 2 

3/8" PERFERATED PUP JNT (W/ SLOTS CUT IN IT). 2 3/8" PSN. 

4-JNTS 2 3/7" EUE TBNG. 5" SLIM HOLE TAC (TECH TAC). PU 

33-JNTS 2 3/8" EUE TBNG. X-O 2 3/8" EUE X 2 7/8" EUE. TALLY 

& RIH OUT OF DERRICK W/ 317-JNTS 2 7/8" EUE TBNG. 

SET TAC @ 10,892''. SEAT NIPPLE @ 11,017'. SECURE WELL.

S.D.F.N.

PUMPED 80 BBLS 2% KCL WTR FOR THE DAY.

USED 75 GAL PROPANE FOR THE DAY.

USED 85 GAL DIESEL FOR THE DAY.

1/27/2012  6:00  7:00 1.00 INARTLT 28 P CT. HELD SAFETY MTNG (ND BOPE, NU W/H). WRITE & REVIEW 

JSA'S. HOT OILER FLUSHED TBNG W/ 60 BBLS HOT 2% KCL 

WTR.

 7:00  9:30 2.50 INARTLT 16 P N/D BOPE. LANDED TBNG IN 25K TENSION. N/U WH. X-O TO 

ROD EQUIP.

 9:30 12:30 3.00 INARTLT 39 P PU & PRIME 2" X 1 1/2" X 28' RHBC INSERT PMP (CDI-CYCLON). 

PU 10-1 1/2" K-BARS. RIH W/ 199-3/4" EL SLK RDS, 120-7/8" EL 

SLK RDS, 109-1" EL SLK RDS. SPACE OUT W/ 2-2', 1-4',1-6' X 1" 

PONY RDS. PU 1 1/2" X 30' PR W/ 1 3/4" X 20' LINER. SEAT PMP 

@ 11,017'. FILL TBNG W/ 50 BB LS HOT 2% KCL WTR. STROKE 

& PRESS TEST TO 1,000 PSI. GOOD TEST.

12:30 13:30 1.00 INARTLT 13 P RU CONV PU. HANG HORSES HEAD.

13:30 14:30 1.00 RDMO 02 R.D.M.O. RETURNED WELL TO PRODUCTION.

PUMPED 160 BBLS 2% KCL WTR FOR THE DAY. 

USED 100 GAL PROPANE FOR THE DAY.

USED 75 GAL DIESEL FOR THE DAY.

 2February 28, 2012 at  9:43 am OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 23397 API Well Number: 43047307900000Sundry Number: 23397 API Well Number: 43047307900000

WESTERN US

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
11:00 17:30 6.50 PRDHEQ 39 P MU&RIHWl23/8"SOLIDPLUG.2-23/8" EUEMUDJNTS.4'X2

3/8" PERFERATED PUP JNT (W/ SLOTS CUT IN IT). 2 3/8" PSN.
4-JNTS 2 3/7" EUE TBNG. 5" SLIM HOLE TAC (TECH TAC). PU
33-JNTS 2 3/8" EUE TBNG.X-O 2 3/8" EUE X 2 7/8" EUE. TALLY
& RIH OUT OF DERRICKW/ 317-JNTS 2 7/8" EUE TBNG.
SET TAC @ 10,892". SEAT NIPPLE @ 11,017'. SECURE WELL.
S.D.F.N.

PUMPED 80 BBLS 2% KCL WTR FOR THE DAY.
USED 75 GAL PROPANE FOR THE DAY.
USED 85 GAL DIESEL FOR THE DAY.

1/27/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 INARTLT 28 P CT. HELD SAFETY MTNG (ND BOPE, NU WlH). WRITE & REVIEW
JSA'S. HOT OILER FLUSHED TBNG Wl60 BBLS HOT 2% KCL
WTR.

7:00 9:30 2.50 INARTLT 16 P N/D BOPE. LANDED TBNG IN 25K TENSION. N/U WH.X-O TO
ROD EQUIP.

9:30 12:30 3.00 INARTLT 39 P PU & PRIME 2" X 1 1/2" X 28' RHBC INSERT PMP (CDI-CYCLON).

PU 10-1 1/2" K-BARS. RIH W/ 199-3/4" EL SLK RDS, 120-7/8" EL
SLK RDS, 109-1" EL SLK RDS. SPACE OUT Wl2-2', 1-4',1-6'X 1"
PONY RDS. PU 1 1/2" X 30' PR W/ 1 3/4" X 20' LINER. SEAT PMP

@ 11,017'. FILL TBNG W/ 50 BB LS HOT 2% KCL WTR. STROKE
& PRESS TEST TO 1,000 PSI. GOOD TEST.

12:30 13:30 1.00 INARTLT 13 P RU CONV PU. HANG HORSES HEAD.
13:30 14:30 1.00 RDMO 02 R.D.M.O. RETURNED WELL TO PRODUCTION.

PUMPED 160 BBLS 2% KCL WTR FOR THE DAY.
USED 100 GAL PROPANE FOR THE DAY.
USED 75 GAL DIESEL FOR THE DAY.

February 28, 2012 at 9:43 am 2 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Feb. 28,



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2012

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N3065- El Paso E&P Company, L.P. N3850- EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX. 77002 Houston, TX. 77002

Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038 Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038

CA No. Unit: N/A

LL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/25/2012
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/25/2012
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/27/2012
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 2114377-0181
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Yes
Sb. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: N/A
Sc. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 6/25/2012
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM N/A BIA Not Received
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: N/A
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: Second Oper Chg
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/29/2012
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/29/2012
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/29/:2012
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: N/A
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JUO705
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 6/29/2012
COMMENTS:
Disposal and Injections wells willbe moved when UIC 5 is received.

El Paso.xis



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

Multiple Leases
6 IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do notuse thisform for proposals to drillnewwells,significantlydeepen existingwells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, orto
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER See Attached

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

El Paso E&P Company, L.P. Attn: Maria Gomez
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1001 Louisiana ciTY Houston STATE TX ZIP 77002 (713) 997-5038 See Attached
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See Attached COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

« CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACl( WATER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOr10inalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUC1NG FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Change of
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Name/Operator

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please be advised that El Paso E&P Company, L.P. (current Operator) has changed names to EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
(new Operator) effective June 1, 2012 and that EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is considered the new operator of the attached
well locations.

EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is responsible under the termsand conditionsof the lease(s) for the operations conducted
upon leased lands. Bond coverage is provided by the State of Utah Statewide Blanket Bond No. 400JUO705, Bureau of Land
Management Nationwide Bond No. 103601420, and Bureau of Indian Affairs Nationwide Bond No. 103601473.

Frank W. Fallerr Frank W. Falleri
Vice President Sr. Vice President
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.

NAME(PLEAS NT) Maria S. Gomez TITLE Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE

E

DATE 6/22/2012

(ThisspaceforStateuseonly) RECEIVED
D JUN2 5 2012

. . . _ gee instrucuans on Reverse sd•) Olv.0F OIL,GAS&MINING"°°bivision of Oil,Gasand Mining-
Earlenekussell, Engineering Techniclaa



El Paso E1 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E1 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

Well Well
Well Name Sec TWP RNG API Number Entity Lease Type Type Status Conf
DVVR3-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301350070 14204621118 OVV APD C
LAKEWOOD ESTATES 3-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301350127 1420H621328 OW APD C
YOUNG3-15A3 15 010S 030W 4301350122 FEE OW APD C
WHITING4-1A2 01 010S 020W 4301350424 Fee OW APD C
ELFUMSO4-34A4 34 010S 040VV 4301350720 Fee OVV APD C
YOUNG 2-281 02 020S 010W 4304751180 FEE OW APD C
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-1084 10 020S 040W 4301350712 18221 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-2684 26 020S 040W 4301350714 18432 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-24B4 24 020S 040W 4301350717 18315 Fee OW DRL C
Cook4-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301351162 18449 Fee OVV DRL C
Peterson4-22C6 22 030S 060VV 4301351163 18518 Fee OVV DRL C
LakeForkRanch4-14B4 14 020S 040VV 4301351240 99999 Fee 04V DRL C
Ahelesco4-20C6 20 030S 060VV 4301351241 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Peck3-13BS 13 020S 050VV 4301351364 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Jensen2-9C4 09 030S 040VV 4301351375 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
El Paso 3-5C4 05 030S 040W 4301351376 18563 Fee OW DRL C
ULT6-31 31 030S 020E 4304740033 FEE O\¾ LA
OBERHANSLY 2-2A1 02 010S 010W 4304740164 FEE OW LA
DWR 3-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301351433 14-20-H62-4724 OW NEW C
LakeForkRanch5-23B4 23 0208 040VV 4301360739 Fee CNV NEVV
DuchesneLand4-10C5 10 030S 050VV 4301351262 Fee OVV NEVV C
Cabinland 4-9B3 09 020S 030W 4301351374 Fee OW NEW C
Layton 4-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301351389 Fee OW NEW C
Golinski4-24BS 24 020S 050VV 4301351404 Fee OiN NE\N C
AII>a1-21C4 21 030S 040VV 4301351460 Fee 04V NEVV C
Allison4-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301351466 Fee ONV NEVV C
Seeley 4-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301351486 Fee OW NEW C
Allen4-25B5 25 020S 050VV 4301351487 Fee OVV NEVV C
Hewett 2-6C4 06 030S 040W 4301351489 Fee OW NEW C
Young2-7C4 07 030S 040VV 4301351500 Fee OVV NEVV C
Brighton 3-31A1E 31 010S 010E 4304752471 Fee OW NEW C
Hamaker3-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304752491 Fee OVV NEVV C
Bolton3-29A1E 29 010S 010E 4304752871 Fee OVV NEVV C
HORROCKS5-20A1 20 010S 010W 4301334280 17378 FEE OW OPS C
DWR 3-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301334263 17440 14-20-462-1120 OW P
DWR 3-22C6 22 030S 060W 4301334106 17298 14-20-462-1131 OW P
DWR 3-28C6 28 030S 060W 4301334264 17360 14-20-462-1323 OW P
UTE 1-7A2 07 010S 020W 4301330025 5850 14-20-462-811 OW
UTE2-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301331033 10115 14-20-H62-1118 OiN P
WLRTRIBAL2-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301331035 10250 14-20-H62-1120 OW P
CEDAR RIM 10-A-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330615 6420 14-20-H62-1128 OW P
CEDAR RIM 12A B 030S 060W 4301331173 10672 14-20-H62-1323 OW P
UTE-FEE 2-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301331123 10365 14-20-H62-1328 OW P
TAYLOR3-34C6 34 030S 060VV 4301350200 17572 1420H621329 CNV P
BAKER UTE 2-34C6 34 030S 060W 4301332634 14590 14-20-H62-1329 OW P
UTE 3-35Z2 K 35 010N 020W 4301331133 10483 14-20-H62-1614 OW P
UTE 1-32Z2 32 010N 020W 4301330379 1915 14-20-H62-1702 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-33D 33 010N 020W 4301330334 1851 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTE 2-33Z2 33 010N 020W 4301331111 10451 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTETRIBAL2-34Z2 010N 020W 4301331167 10668 14-20-H62-1704 OW
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-13B4 13 020S 040W 4301334262 17439 14-20-H62-1743 OW P
Üii 1-28B4 28 020S 040VV 4301330242 1796 14-20-H62-1745 OVV P
UTE 1-34A4 34 010S 040W 4301330076 1585 14-20-H62-1774 OW P
UTE 1-36A4 36 010S 040VV 4301330069 1580 14-20-H62-1793 (MN P
UTE 1-1B4 01 020S 040W 4301330129 1700 14-20-H62-1798 OW P
UTE 1-31A2 31 010S 020VV 4301330401 1925 14-20-H62-1801 (MN P |



El Paso E2 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E2 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE1-25A3 25 010S 030VV4301330370 1920 'Wi-20-H62-1802 OVV P
UTE 2-25A3 25 010S 030W 4301331343 11361 14-20-H62-1802 OW P
UTE 1-26A3 26 OS 030W 4301330348 1890 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTE 2-26A3 26 010S 030W 4301331340 11349 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTETRIBAL4-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301350274 18009 1420H621804 OVV P C
UTE 2-35A3 35 010S 030W 4301331292 11222 14-20-H62-1804 ÖW P
UTE3-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301331365 11454 14-20-H62-1804 OIVV P
UTE 145B2 06 0208: 020VV4301330349 1895 14-20-H62-1807 O\N P
UTE 2-6B2 06 020S 020W 4301331140 11190 14-20-H62-1807 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-682 06 020S 020W 4301350273 18008 14-20-H62-1807 OW P C
POWELL 4-19A1 19 010S 010W 4301330071 8302 14-20-H62-1847 OW P
COLTHARP 1-27Z1 27 010N 010W 4301330151 4700 14-20-H62-1933 OW P
UTE 1-8A1E 08 010S 010E 4304730173 1846 14-20-H62-2147 OW P
UTETRIBE 1-31 31 010N 020VV 4301330278 4755 14-20-H62-2.421 OVV P
UTE 1-28B6X 28 020S 060W 4301330510 11165 14-20-H62-2492 OW P
RINKER 2-21B5 21 020S 050W 4301334166 17299 14-20-H62-2508 OW P
MURDOCK 2-34B5 34 020S 050W 4301331132 10456 14-20-H62-2511 OW P
LffE 1-3586 [35 0206; 060VV4301330507 2335 14-20-H62-2531 O\N P
UTE TRIBAL1-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304730829 860 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE 2-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304737831 16709 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE TRIBAL1-27A1E \27 010S 010E 4304730421 800 14-20-H62-2662 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-35A1E 35 010S 010E 4304730286 795 14-20-H62-2665 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-15A1E 15 010S 010E 4304730820 850 14-20-H62-2717 OW P
UTE TRIBAL P-3B1E 03 02 S 010E 4304730190 4536 14-20-H62-2873 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-22ATE 22 010S 010E 4304730429 810 14-20-H62-3103 OW P
BHUTE1-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301330419 10705 14-20-H62-3436 09/ P
BHUTE2-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301332790 15802 14-20-H62-3436 OV/ P
MCFARLANE 1-4D6 04 040S 060W 4301331074 10325 14-20-H62-3452 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-11D6 11 040S 060W 4301330482 6415 14-20-H62-3454 OW P
CARSON 2-36A1 36 010S 010W 4304731407 737 14-20-H62-3806 OW P
UTE 2-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301330775 9133 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
DWR 3-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301334003 17092 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
THE PERFECT "10" 1-10A1 10 010S 010W 4301330935 9461 14-20-H62-3855 OW
BADGER-SAM HU MONGUS1-15A1 15 010S 010W 4301330949 9462 14-20-H62-3860 OW P
MAXIMILLIAN-UTE14-1 14 010S 030W 4301330726 8437 14-20-H62-3868 OW P
FRED BASSETT 1-22A1 22 010S 010W 4301330781 9460 14-20-H62-3880 OW
UTETRIBAL1-30Z1 30 010N 010VV 4301330813 9405 14-20-H62-3910 OVV P
UTE LB 1-13A3 13 010S 030W 4301330894 9402 14-20-H62-3980 OW P
UTE2-22B6 22 020S 060VV 4301331444 11641 14-20-H62-4614 OVV P
UINTA QURAY 1-1A3 01 010S 030W 4301330132 5540 14-20-H62-4664 OW P
UTE 1-6D6 06 040S 060W 4301331696 12058 14-20-H62-4752 0W
UTE2-11D6 11 040S 060VV 4301350179 17667 1420H624801 OVV P
LÏÑï1-15D6 15 040S 060VV 4301330429 10958 14-20-H62-4824 OVV P
UTE2-15D6 15 040S 060W 4301334026 17193 14-20-H624824 OW
HILL3-24C6 24 030S 060VV 4301350293 18020 1420H624866 OVV P C
BARCLAYUTE 2-24C6R 24 030S 060W 4301333730 16385 14-20-H62-4866 OW P
BROTHERSON 1-2B4 |02 020S 040W 4301330062 1570 FEE OW P
BOREN 1-24A2 24 010S 020W 4301330084 5740 FEE _ 0W
FARNSWORTH 1-13BS 13 020S 050W 4301330092 1610 FEE OW P
BROADHEAD 1-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301330100 1595 FEE OW P
ASAYEJ 1-20A1 20 010S 010VV 4301330102 8304 FEE OVV P
HANSONTRUST 1-5B3 05 020S 030W 4301330109 1635 FEE OW P
ELLSO/ORTH1-8B4 08 020S 040VV 4301330112 1655 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-9B4 09 020S 040VV 4301330118 1660 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-17B4 17 020S 040VV 4301330126 1695 FEE OVV P
CHANDLER1-5B4 05 020S 040VV 4301330140 1685 FEE OVV P
HANSON1-32A3 32 010S 030VV 4301330141 1640 FEE OVV P
JESSEN 1-17A4 17 010S 040VV 4301330173 4725 FEE OVV P



El Paso E3 Company, LP. (N3065) to EP Energy E3 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

JENKINS1-1B3 01 020S 030VV 4301330175 1790 FEE O¾V P
GOODRICH 1-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301330182 1765 FEE OW P
ELLSVVORTH1-19B4 19 020S 040VV 4301330183 1760 FEE ONV P
O(TYLE1-10B3 10 020S 030VV 4301330187 1810 FEE OVV P
JOS. SMITH1-17C5 17 iO30S 050W 4301330188 5510 FEE OW
RUDY 1-11B3 11 020S 030W \43013302041820 FEE OW
CROCu(1-BB4 06 020S 040VV 4301330213 1825 FEE OVV P
HUNT1-21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301330214 1840 FEE OVV P
LAVVRENCE1-30B4 30 020S 040VV 4301330220 1845 FEE ONV P
YOUNK31-29B4 29 020S 040VV 4301330246 1791 FEE 04V P
GRIFFITHS1-33B4 33 020S 040W 4301330288 4760 FEE OW
PCrrTER1-2B5 02 020S 050VV 4301330293 1826 FEE DVV P
BRCITHERSCR41-26B4 26 020S 040VV 4301330336 1856 FEE ONV P
SADIEMBLANK1-33Z1 33 010N 010VV 4301330355 765 FEE OVV P
PCFEFER 1-24B5 24 020S 050VV 4301330356 1730 FEE O\N P
VVHITEHELAD1-22A3 22 010S: 030VV 4301330357 1885 FEE OVV P
CHASELMILLER2-1A2 01 010S 0200/ 4301330360 5830 FEE OWI P
ELDER1-13B2 13 020S 020VV 4301330366 1905 FEE OVV P
BROTHERSON 2-10B4 10 020S 040W 4301330443 1615 FEE OW P
FARNSWORTH 2-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301330470 1935 FEE OW P
TEVV1-15A3 15 010S 030VV 4301330529 1945 FEE OVV P
UTEFEE2-20C5 20 030S 050VV 4301330550 4527 FEE ONV P
FN3USTCad1-34Z1 34 010N 010VV 4301330566 885 FEE OVV P
GALLOVVAY1-18B1 18 020S 010VV 4301330575 2365 FEE OVV P
SMfTH1-31B5 31 020S 050VV 4301330577 1955 FEE OVV P
LEBEAU 1-34A1 34 010S 010W 4301330590 1440 FEE OW P
LINMAR1-19B2 19 020S 020VV 4301330600 9350 FEE O\N P
AflSSE1-28Z1 28 010N 010VV 4301330609 905 FEE ONV P
POVVELL1-21B1 21 020S 010VV 4301330621 910 FEE OVV P
HANSEN 1-24B3 24 020S 030VV 4301330629 2390 FEE OVV P
OhAAN2-4B4 04 020S 040VV 4301330645 9125 FEE OVV P
DYE 1-25Z2 25 010N 020W 4301330659 9111 FEE OW
HMARTIN 1-21Z1 21 010N 010VV 4301330707 925 FEE OVV P
JENSEN 1-29Z1 29 010N 010W 4301330725 9110 FEE OW P
CHASEL2-17A1V 17 010S 010VV 4301330732 9112 FEE OVV P
BIRCHELL 1-27A1 27 010S 010W 4301330758 940 FEE OW P
CHRISTENSEN2-8B3 08 020S 030W 4301330780 9355 FEE OW
LAMICQ2-SB2 05 020S 020W 4301330784 2302 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 2-14B4 14 020S 040W 4301330815 10450 FEE OW P
WRJRRAA'3-2A2 02 010S 020VVl4301330816 9620 FEE OVV P
HORROCKS2-20A1 V 20 010S 010W 4301330833 8301 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON2-2B4 02 020S 040W 4301330855 8420 FEE ÒV\Ï P
ELLSVVORTH2-8B4 08 020S 040VV 4301330898 2418 FEE OVV P
Òhi4N2-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301330904110045 FEE OVV P
BELCHER2-33B4 33 020S 040VV4301330907 9865 FEE OVV P
BROTHERSON 2-35B5 35 020S 050W 4301330908 9404 FEE OW
HORROCKS 2-4A1 T 04 010S 010W 4301330954 9855 FEE OW P
JENSEN2-29A5 29 010S 050VV4301330974 10040 FEE OVV P
UTE2-34A4 34 010S 040VV 4301330978 10070 FEE OVV P
CHANDLER2-5B4 05 020S 040VV 4301331000 10075 FEE OVV
BABCOCK2-1284 12 020S 040VV 4301331005 10215 FEE OW/ P
BADGER MR BOOM BOOM 2-29A1 29 010S 010W 4301331013 9463 FEE OW
BLEAJAARD2-18B4 18 020S 040VV4301331025 1566 FEE OVV P
BROADHEAD 2-32B5 32 020S 050W 4301331036 10216 FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-1684 16 0208 040W 43013Š1046 10217 FEE OW
RUST3-4B3 04 020S 030VV4301331070 1576 FEE OVV P
HANSON TRUST 2-32Äi 3i 030W 4ŠÕT331072154T ËËË ÒŸÏ P
BROTHElfSOffž-fiŠÀ 02ÕŠÏ040W 4301331078 1541 FEE OW P



El Paso E4 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E4 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HANSONTRUST2-5B3 05 020S 0309/ 4301331079 1636 FEE ONV P
BROTHERSON 2-15B4 15 020S 040W 4301331103 1771 FEE OW P
MONSEN2-27A3 27 010S 030W 4301331104 1746 FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-19B4 19 020S 040W 4301331105 1761 FEE OW P
HUNT2-;21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301331114 1839 FEE OVV P
JENKINS2-1B3 _ 01 020S 030W 4301331117 1792 FEE OW P
PCTTTER2-24BS 24 020S 050VV4301331118 1731 FEE OVV P
POVVELL2-13A2 K 13 010S 020VV 4301331120 8306 FEE OVV P
JENKINS 2-12B3 12 020S 030W 4301331121 10459 FEE OW P
MURDCK3K2-26B5 26 020S 050VV 4301331124 1531 FEE O\N P
BIRCH 3-27B5 27 020S 050W 4301331126 1783 FEE OW P
ROBB 2-2985 29 020S 050W 4301331130 10454 FEE OW P
LAKEFORK2-13B4 13 020S 040VV 4301331134 10452 FEE OVV P
DUNCAN 3-1A2 K 01 010S 020W 4301331135 10484 FEE OW P
HAJ4SON2-983 09 0208; 030VV 4301331136 10455 FEE O\N P
ELLSVIORTH2-9B4 09 0208 040VV 4301331138 10460 FEE OVV P
UTE2-31A2 31 010S 020VV 4301331139 10458 FEE OVV P
POVVELL2-19A1 K 19 010S 010VV 4301331149 8303 FEE OVV P
CEDAR RIM 8-A 22 030S 060W 4301331171 10666 FEE OW P
POTTER 2-684 06 0208 040W 4301331249 11038 FEE OW P
MILES2-1B5 Oi 020S 050W 4301331257 11062 FEE ÒW
MILES2-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301331261 11102 FEE OW P
MONSEN 2-22A3 22 010S 030W 4301331265 11098 FEE OW P
M/RK3HT2-13B5 13 020S 050VV 4301331267 11115 FEE VV P
TODD2-21A3 21 010S 030W 4301331296 11268 FEE OW P
VVElit4RT2-29B4 3Ï 020S 040VV 4301331298 11332 FEE lOVV P
YOUNG2-15A3 15 010S 030W 4301331301 11344 FEE
CHRISTENSEN2-29A4 29 010S 040VV 4301331303 11235 FEE O\N I
BLEAZARD2-28B4 28 020S 040W 4301331304 11433 FEE OW P
REARY2-17A3 17 010S 030W 4301331318 11251 FEE OW P
LAZYK2-11B3 11 020S 030VV 4301331352 11362 FEE OVV P
LAZYK 2-14B3 14 020S 030W 4301331354 11452 FEE OW
MifFTHEVVS2-13B2 13 020S 020VV 4301331357 11374 FEE OVV P
LAKEFORK 3-15B4 15 020S 040W 4301331358 11378 FEE OW
STEVENSCHM3-29A3 29 010S 030VV 4301331376 11442 FEE CAN P
MEEKS3-883 08 020S 0300/ 4301331377 11489 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH3-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301331389 11488 FEE OVV P
DUNCAN5-13A2 13 010S 020VV 4301331516 11776 FEE CNV P
CAÑL3-17C5 17 030S 050VV 4301332112 12476 FEE OiN P
BROTHERSON2-24B4 24 020S 040?! 4301332695 14652 FEE O¾V P
BCH3RERO2-15B3 15 020S 030VV 4301332755 14750 FEE ONV P
BROTHERSON2-25B4 25 020S 040W 4301332791 15044 FEE OW P
CABINLAND2-1683 16 020S 030W 4301332914 15236 FEE OW P
KATHERINE 3-29B4 29 020S 040W 4301332923 15331 FEE OW P
SHRINERS2-10C5 10 030S 050W 4301333008 15908 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON2-26B4 26 020S 040W 4301333139 17047 FEE OW P
MORTENSEN 4-32A2 32 010S 020W 4301333211 15720 FEE OV\Ï
FERRARINI 3-2784 020S 040W 4301333265 15883 FEE OW P
RHOADES2-25B5 25 020S 050W 4301333467 16046 FEE OW P
CASE2-31B4 31 020S 040VV 4301333548 16225 FEE OVV P
ANDERSON-ROWLEY 2-24B3 2_4 020S 030W 4301333616 16284 FEE P
SPROUSE BOWDEN2-18B1 18 020S 010W 4301333808 16677 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 3-11B4 11 020S 040W 4301333904 16891 FEE OW
KOFFORD2-36B5 36 020S 050VV 4301333988 17048 FEE O\N P
ALLEN 3-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301334027 17166 FEE OW
BOURNAKIS3-18B4 18 020S 040VV 4301334091 17264 FEE |3f! P
MILES3-12B5 12 020S 050VV 4301334110 17316 FEE OVV P
OWL and HAWK 2-31B5 31 020S 050W 4301334123 17388 FEE OW P



El Paso E5 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E5 Company, LP. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

OWL and°HAWK 4-17C5 17 030S 050W 4301334193 17387 FEE OW P
DVVR3-32B5 32 020S 050VV 4301334207 17371 FEE C¾V P
LAKEFORKRANCH 3-2284 22 0208 040W 4301334261 17409 FEE OW P
HANSON3-9B3 09 020S 030VI 4301350065 17570 FEE OVV P
DYE2-28A1 28 010S 010VV 4301350066 17531 FEE O\¾ P
MEEKS3-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301350069 17605 FEE ONV P
HANSC‡J4-8B3 08 020S 030VV 4301350088 17571 FEE OVV rP C
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-14B4 14 020S 040W 4301350097 17484 FEE OW P
ALLEN 3-9B4 09 020S 040W 4TÕŒ55ÏžŠ17656 FEE W
HORROCKS4-20A1 20 010S 010W 4301350155 17916 FEE OW
HURLEY2-33A1 33 010S 010VV 4301350166 17573 FEE ONV P
HUTCHINS/CHIODO3-20C5 20 030S 050W 4301350190 17541 FEE OW
ALLEN3-8B4 08 020S 0409/ 4301350192 17622 FEE OVV P
OWILandHAVVK3-10C5 10 030S 050VV 4301350193 17532 FEE OMt P
ÒWÏ.and HAWK 3-19CS 19 030S 050W 4301350201 17508 FEE OW P
EL PASO 4-29B5 29 020S 050W 4301350208 17934 FEE OW C
DONIHUE3-20C6 20 030S 060VV 4301350270 17762 FEE OVV P
FUMMSON3-5B3 05 020S 030VV 4301350275 17725 FEE 04V P C
SPRATT 3-26B5 26 020S 050W 4301350302 17668 FEE OW P
REBEL3-35B5 35 020S 050VV 4301350388 17911 FEE O¾V P C
FREEMAN 4-1684 16 020S 040W 4301350438 17935 Fee OW P
VVILSON3-36B5 36 020S 050VV 4301350439 17936 Fee ONV P C
ELPASO3-21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301350474 18123 Fee 04V P C
IORIGat-12B3 12 020S 030VV 4301350487 17981 Fee O\N P C
CONOVER3-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301350526 18122 Fee OW P C
ROVVLEY3-16B4 16 020S 040VV 4301350569 18151 Fee OVV P C
POTTS 3-1483 14 020S 030W 4301350570 18366 Fee OW P C
FN3TTER4-27B5 27 020S 050VV 4301350571 99999 Fee CNV P C
EL PASO 4-21B4 21 020S 040W 4301350572 18152 Fee OW
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-26B4 26 020S 040W 4301350707 18270 Fee OW C
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-25B4 25 020S 040W 4301350711 18220 Fee OW P C
LAKEFK)RKFLANCH4-23B4 23 020S 040VV 4301350713 18271 Fee CNV P C
LAKEFORKRANCH4-15B4 15 020S 040VV 4301350715 18314 Fee OVV P C
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-24B4 24 020S 040W 4301350716 18269 Fee OW P C
GOLINSKI1-8C4 08 030S 040?! 4301350986 18301 Fee 04V P C
JFU3BERTSON 1-1B1 01 020S 01044 4304730174 5370 FEE C4V P
TIMOTiff1-8B1E 08 020S 010E 4304730215 1910 FEE OVV P
MAGDALENEPAPADOPULOS 1-34A1E 34 010S 010E 4304730241 785 FEE OW P
NELSON1-3tA1E 31 010S 010E 4304730671 830 FEE OVV P
ROSEMARY LLOYD1-24A1E 24 010S 010E 4304730707 840 FEE OW P
HD LANDY1-30A1E O 010S 010E 4304730790 845 FEE OW P
WALKER1-14A1E 14 010S 010E 4304730805 855 FEE OW P
BOLTON2-29A1E 29 010S 010E 4304731112 900 FEE OW P
PRESCCAT1-35Z1 kÏ 010N 010VV 4304731173 1425 FEE OVV P
BISEL GURR 11-1 11 010S 010W 4304731213 8438 FEE OW
UTETRIBAL2-22A1E 22 010S 010E 4304731265 915 FEE OVV P
L. BOLTON 1-12A1 12 010S 010W 4304731295 920 FEE OW P
FOWLES1-26A1 26 010S 010W 4304731296 930 FEE OVV
BRADLEY23-1 23 010S 010W 4304731297 8435 FEE OW P
BASTIAN 1-2A1 02 010S 010W 4304731373 Ì36 ËE ÃÏ
DR LONGž-15A1Ë i 010S 010E 4Š0ÀÌ314709ŠÕŒÏ ËË ÄÏ
DMCK3N1-23Z1 23 010N 010VV 4304731479 10310 FEE O\N P
O MOON 2-26Z1 26 010N 010W 4304731480 10135 FEE OW
LILAD2-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304731797 10790 FEE OVV P
LANDY2-30A1E 30 010S 010E 4304731895 11127 FEE OVV P
VVINNP2-3B1E 03 0206: 010E 4304732321 11428 FEE OiN P
BISEL-GURR 2-11A1 11 010S 010W 4304735410 14428 FEE OW P
FLYlNGJFEE2-12A1 12 010S 010VV 4304739467 16686 FEE OVV P



El Paso E6 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E6 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HARVEST FELLOWSHIP CHURCH2-14B1 020S 010W 4304739591 16546 FEE OW P
OBERHANSLY 3-11A1 _ 010S 010W 4304739679 17937 FEE OW
DUNCAN 2-34A1 34 010S 010W 4304739944 17043 FEE OW P
BISEL GURR 4-11A1 11 010S 010W 4304739961 16791 FEE OW
KILLIAN3-12A1 12 010S: 010VV 4304740226 17761 ML39760 O\N P
WAINOCO ST 1-1ÀB 020S 010W 4304730818 1420 ML-24306-A OW
UTAH ST UTE 1-35A1 35 010S 010W 4304730182 5520 ML-25432 OW
ST/VTE 1-19A4 19 0106; 040VV 4301330322 9118 ML-27912 OiN P
FEDERAL 2-28E19E 28 OSOS 190E 4304732849 12117 UTU-0143512 OW
FEDERAL 1-28E19E 28 050S 190E 4304730175 5680 UTU143512 O\¾ P
BLANCHARD 1-3A2 03 010S 020W 4301320316 5877 FEE OW PA
WH BLANCHARD 2-3A2 03 010S 020W 4301330008 5775 FEE OW PA
YACKU 1-7A1 07 010S 010VV 4301330018 5795 FEE OVV PA
JAAAESPOVVELL3 _ 13 010S 020VV 4301330024 8305 FEE VVD PA
BASTIAN1(3-7D) 07 010S 010VV 4301330026 5800 FEE OLV PA
LAMICQ-URRUTY 1-8A2 08 010S 020W 4301330036 5975 FEE OW_ PA
BLEAJJARD1-18B4 18 020S 040VV 4301330059 11262 FEE OVV PA
OLSEN 1-27A4 27 010S 040VV 4301330064 1565 FEE OVV F%4
EVANS 1-31A4 31 010S 040W 4301330067 5330 FEE OW
HAAABLIN1-26A2 26 010S 020VV 4301330083 2305 FEE OUV _F4
HARTMAN 1-31A3 31 010S 030W 4301330093 10700 FEE OW PA
FARNSWORTH1-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301330097 5725 FEE OW A
POVVELL1-33A3 33 010S 030VV 4301330105 4526 FEE OVV 44
LOTRIDGEGATES 1-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301330117 1625 FEE OW
REMINGTON 1-34A3 34 010S 030W 4301330139 1670 FEE OW
ANDERSON 1-28A2 28 010S 020W 4301330150 5895 FEE OW
RHOADESMOON 1-35B5 35 020S 050W 4301330155 5270 FEE OW PA
JC44N 1-3B2 03 020S 020VV 4301330160 5765 FEE O\N
SMITH 14C5 06 030S 050VV 4301330163 5385 FEE OVV F44
HORRCK3KSFEE 1-3A1 03 010S 010VV 4301330171 5505 FEE OVV !¾4
VVARREN1-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301330174 9139 FEE CAV PA
JENSENFENZEL1-20C5 20 030S 050VV 4301330177 4730 FEE ONV PA
MNTilNRANCH1-13B4 13 020S 040VV 4301330180 4524 FEE OVV PA
BFKITHERSON 1-27B4 27 020S 040VV 4301330185 1775 FEE OVV PA
JENSEN 1-31AS 31 010S 050VV 4301330186 4735 FEE OVV 144
ROBERTSON 1-29A2 29 010S 020W 4301330189 4740 FEE OW Ä
VVINKLER1-28A3 28 010S 030VV 4301330191 5465 FEE ONV PA
CHENEY1-33A2 33 010S 020VV 4301330202 1750 FEE O¾V 144
J LAMICQSTATE 1-681 06 020S 010W 4301330210 5730 FEE OW PA
REESEESTATE1-10B2 10 020S 020VV 4301330215 5700 FEE OlVV I¾\
REEDER1-17B5 17 020S 050VV 4301330218 5460 FEE O\N PA
ROBERTSONUTE 1-2B2 02 020S 020W 4301330225 1710 FEE OW A
HATCH1-5B1 05 020S 010VV 4301330226 5470 FEE OVV PA
BROTHERSON1-22B4 22 020S 040VV 4301330227 5935 FEE OVV PA
ALLRED1-16A3 16 010S 030VV 4301330232 1780 FEE OVV 144
BIRCH1-35A5 35 010S 0509/ 4301330233 9116 FEE OVV 4
MARQUERITEUTE 1-882 08 020S 020W 4301330235 9122 FEE OW A
BU22I1-11B2 11 020S 020VV4301330248 6335 FEE 01N 44
SHISLER 1-3B 03 020S 010VV4301330249 5960 FEE OW A
TEW 1-1B5 01 020S 050W 4301330264 5580 FEE OW Ã
EVANSUTE 1-19B3 020S 030W 4301330265 1870 FEE OW PA
SHELL2-27A4 N 010S 1040W 4301330266 1776 FEE WD PA
DYE1-29A1 29 010S 010VV 4301330271 99990 FEE OVV 144
\/ODAUTE 1-‡C5 0.4 030S 050VV4301330283 4530 FEE 09V PA
BROTHERSON 1-28A4 010S 040W 4301330292 9114 FEE OW PA
MEAGHER 1-4B2 04 020S 020W 4301330313 8402 FEE OW PA
NORLING 1-9B1 020S 010W 4301330315 1811 FEE OW Ä
S. BROADHEAD 1-9C5 09 030S 050W 4301330316 5940 FEE OW PA



El Paso E7 Company, LP. (N3065) to EP Energy E7 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

TIh&DTHY1-09A3 09 010S 030VV 4301330321 10883 FEE 04V PA
BARRETT 1-34A5 34 010S 050W 4301330323 9115 FEE OW PA
MEAGHER TRIBAL 1-9B2 09 020S 020W 4301330325 9121 FEE OW PA
PHILLIPSUTE 1-3C5 03 030S 050W 4301330333 1816 FEE OW PA
ELLSWIORTH1-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301330351 6375 FEE ONV PA
LAVVSC‡J1-28A1 28 010S 010VV 4301330358 5915 FEE OVV PA
An ES1-23A4 23 010S 040VV 4301330375 1901 FEE OVV PA
HORROCKS1-6A1 06 010S 010W 4301330390 5675 FEE OW PA
SHRINE HOSPITAL 1-10C5 10 0308 050W 4301330393 5565 FEE OW Pi
GOODRICH 1-1882 18 020S 020VV 4301330397 5485 FEE O\N PA
SVVDPOVVELL3 13 010S 020VV 4301330478 10708 FEE VVD PA
BODRERO1-15B3 15 020S 030W 4301330565 4534 FEE OW
AkOC‡4TRIBAL1-30C4 30 030S 040VV 4301330576 2360 FEE ONV PA
DUNCAN2-9B5 09 020S 050VV 4301330719 5440 FEE ONV PA
FISHER1-16A4 16 010S 040VV 4301330737 2410 FEE ONV PA
URRUTY2-34A2 34 010S 020VV 4301330753 9117 FEE ONV PA
GiOODRICH1-24A4 24 010S 040VV 4301330760 2415 FEE 04V PA
CARLSMITH2-25A4 25 0108 040VV 4301330776 9136 FEE 04V PA
ANDERSC‡J1-A30B1 30 020S 010VV 4301330783 9137 FEE OVV PA
CADILLAC3-6A1 06 010S 010W 4301330834 6316 FEE OW PA
MCELPRANG 2-31A1 31 010S 010W 4301330836 8439 FEE OW A
REESE ESTATE 2-10B2 10 020S 020W 4301330837 2417 FEE OW
CLARK2-9A3 09 010S 030W 4301330876 2416 FEE OW PA
JENKINS3-16A3 16 010S 030VV 4301330877 9790 FEE ONV PA
CHRISTENSEN2-26AS 26 010S 050VV 4301330905 10710 FEE ONV PA
FORD2-36A5 36 010S 050VV 4301330911 9630 FEE O¾V PA
MORTENSEN 2-32A2 32 010S 02OW 4301330929 9486 FEE OW PA
M/ILKERSON 1-20Z1 20 010N 010VV 4301330942 5452 FEE ONV PA
UTE TRIBAL 2-4A3 S 04 010S 030W 4301330950 10230 FEE OW
OBERHANSLY2-31Z1 31 010N 010VV 4301330970 9262 FEE Ï>Al I¾\
MORRIS2-TA3 07 010S 030VV 4301330977 9725 FEE ONV PA
POVVELL2-08A3 08 010S 030VV4301330979 10175 FEE OVV PA
FISHER24A3 06 010S 030VV 4301330984 10110 FEE OVV PA
JACOBSEN2-12A4 2 010S 040VV 4301330985 10480 FEE OVV PA
CHENEY2-33/G 33 010S 020VV 4301331042 10313 FEE OVV PA
HANSON TRUST 2-29A3 29 010S 030W 4301331043 5306 FEE OW PA
BURTON2-15B5 15 020S 050VV 4301331044 10205 FEE OVV PA
ËÃh4NS-UTE2-1783 17 020S 030VV 4301331056 10210 FEE LDVV PA
ELLSVVORTH2-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301331090 5336 FEE 04V !%4
REMINGTON 2-34A3 34 010S 030W 4301331091 1902 FEE OW PA
VVINKLER2-28A3 28 010S 030VV 4301331109 4519 FEE O\¾ PA
TEVV2-10B5 10 020S 050VV 4301331125 1751 FEE ONV PA
LIND6WAY2-33A4 33 010S 040VV 4301331141 1756 FEE OVV PA
FIELDSTED2-28A4 28 010S 040VV 4301331293 10665 FEE OVV PA
POWELL 4-13A2 13 010S 020W 4301331336 11177 FEE GW PA
DUMP2-20A3 20 010S 030W 4301331505 11691 FEE OW PA
SMITH2X-23C7 23 0308 070VV 4301331634 12382 FEE D PA
MORTENSEN 3-32A2 32 010S 020W 4301331872 11928 FEE OW PA
TODDUSA ST 1-2B1 02 020S 010W 4304730167 99998 FEE OW PA
STATE1-7B1E 07 020S 010E 4304730180 5555 FEE OW
BACON1-10B1E 10 020S 010E 4304730881 5550 FEE ONV PA
PARIETTEDRAW 28-44 28 040S 010E 4304731408 4537 FEE OW PA
REYNOLDS2-7B1E 07 020S 010E 4304731840 4960 FEE OW PA
STATE2-35A2 35 010S 020W 4301330156 4715 ML-22874 OW PA
UTAH STATE LB 1-11B1 11 020S 010W 4304730171 5530 ML-23655 OW PA
STATE1-8A3 08 010S 030W 4301330286 5655 ML-24316 OW A
UTAHFEDERAL1-24B1 24 020S 010W 4304730220 590 ML-26079 OW PA
CEDAR RIM 15 34 030S 060W 4301330383 6395 14-20-462- 29 OW S



El Paso E8 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E8 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE TRIBAL2-24C7 24 030S 070W 4301331028 10240 14-20-H62-1135 OW S
CEDARRIM12 28 030S 060W 4301330344 6370 14-20-H62-1323 OW IS
CEDARRIM16 33 030S 060W 4301330363 6390 14-20-H62-1328 OW S
SPRING HOLLOW 2-34Z3 34 010N 030W 4301330234 5255 14-20-H62-1480 OW S
E3/ANSUTE1-17B3 17 020S 030VV 4301330274 5335 14-20-H62-1733 OVV S
UTE JENKS 2-1-B4 G 01 020S 040W 4301331197 10844 14-20-H62-1782 OW S
LffE3-12B3 12 020S 030VV 4301331379 11490 14-20-H62-1810 OVV S
UTE TRIBAL9-4B1 04 020S 010W 4301330194 5715 14-20-H62-1969 OW S
UTE TRIBAL 2-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301331424 11615 14-20-H62-2489 OW S
UTE 1-33B6 33 020S 060W 4301330441 1230 14-20-H62-2493 OW S
UTE2-22B5 22 0206; 050VV 4301331122 10453 14-:20-H62-2509 O\N S
UTE1-1881E 18 020S 010E 4304730969 9135 14-20-H62-2864 O\¾ S
LAUREN UTE 1-23A3 23 010S 030W 4301330895 9403 14-20-H62-3981 OW S
UTE 2-28B6 28 020S 060W 4301331434 116i4 14-20-H62-4622 OW S
UTE 1-27B6X 27 020S 060W 4301330517 11166 14-20-H62-4631 OW S
UTE2-27B6 27 020S 060VV 4301331449 11660 14-20-H62-4:331 ONV S
CEDAR RIM10-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330328 6365 14-20-H62-4724 OW 5
UTE 5-30A2 30 010S 020W 4301330169 5910 14-20-H62-4863 OW S
UTE TRIBAL G-1 (1-24C6) 24 030S 060W 4301330298 4533 14-20-H62-4866 OW S
UTE TRIBAL FEDERAL 1-30C5 30 030S 050W 4301330475 665 14-20-H62-4876 OW S
SMB1-10A2 10 010S 020VV 4301330012 5865 FEE OVV S
KENDALL1-12A2 12 010S 020VV 4301330013 5875 FEE ONV S
CEDARRIM2 20 030S 060VV .4301330019 6315 FEE ONV S
URRUTY 2-9A2 09 010S 020W 4301330046 5855 FEE OW S
BROTHERSON 1-14B4

J¯
ÕžÕŠ040W

4301330Ò5
1̄535 FEE OW

RUST1-4B3 04 020S 030VV 4301330063 1575 FEE OVV S
WK3NSEN1-21A3 21 010S 030VV4301330082 1590 FEE O\¾ S
BFKITHERSCRM1-10B4 10 020S 040VV 4301330110 1614 FEE ONV S
FÄRNSWORTH 1-12B5 12 020S 050W 4301330124 1645 FEE OW 5
ELLSVIORTH1-16B4 16 020S 040VV .4301330192 1735 FEE ONV S
MARSHALL1-;K)A3 20 010S 030VV 4301330193 9340 FEE OVV S
CHRISTMAN BLAND 1-31B4 31 020S 040W 4301330198 4745 FEE M S
FK)PER1-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301330217 1850 FEE O\¾ S
EUROTHERSO‡l1-24B4 24 020S 040VV 4301330229 1865 FEE OVV S
BFMITHERSCRM1-33A4 33 010S 040VV 4301330272 1680 FEE ONV S
BROTHERSON 1-23B4 23 020S 040W 4301330483 8423 FEE OW S
SMITHALBERT2-8C5 08 030S 050VV 4301330543 5495 FEE OVV S
VODAJOSEPHINE2-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301330553 5650 FEE ONV S
HANSEN1-16B3 16 020S 030VV 4301330617 9124 FEE OVV S
BFMITHERSCR41-25B4 25 020S 040VV 4301330668 9126 FEE 04V S
POWELL 2-33A3 33 010S 030W 4301330704 2400 FEE OW S
BROWN2-28B5 28 020S 050W 4301330718 9131 FEE OW
EULA-UTE1-16A1 16 010S 010VV 4301330782 8443 FEE O\N S
JESSEN 1-15A4 15 010S 040VV 4301330817 9345 FEE ONV S
REK3USTON 1-22Z1 22 010N 010VV 4301330884 936 FEE 04V S
FIELDSTED 2-27A4 27 010S 040W 4301330915 9632 FEE OW S
HANSKUTT 2-23B5 _ 23 020S 050W 4301330917 9600 FEE OW S
TIMOTHY 4-18A3 18 010S 030W 4301330940 9633 FEE OW S
BFKITHERSON2-3B4 03 020S 040VV 4301331008 10165 FEE ONV S
BROTHERSON 2-22B4 22 020S 1040W 4301331086 1782 FEE OW S
MILES2-35A4 35 010S 040W 4301331087 1966 FEE OW S
ELLSWORTH 2-17B4 17 020S 040W 4301331089 1696 FEE OW
RUST 2-36A4 36 010S 040W 4301331092 1577 FEE OW S
E\h4NS2-19B3 19 020S 030VV 4301331113 1777 FEE OiN iS
FARNSWORTH 2-12BS 12 020S 050W 4301331115 1646 FEE OW S
CHRISTENSEN 3-4B4 04 020S 040W 4301331142 10481 FEE OW Š
ROBERTSON 2-29A2 29 010S 020W ¡430133115010679 , FEE OW S
CEDAR RIM2A näiÏW 4301331172 10671 E OW S
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HARTMAN 2-31A3 31 010S 030W 4301331243 11026 FEE OW S
GOODRICH 2-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301331246 11037 FEE OW 'S
JESSEN2-:21A4 21 0106; 040VV 4301331256 11061 FEE C\N S
BROTHERSON3-23B4 23 020S 040W 4301331289 11141 FEE OW S
MYRIN FDANCH2-18B3 18 020S 030VV 4301331297 11475 FEE CAN S
BROTHERSON2-2B5 02 020S 050W 4301331302 11342 FEE OW S
DASTRUP2-30A3 30 010S 030VV 4301331320 11253 FEE 04V S
YOUNK32-30B4 30 020S 040VV 4301331366 11453 FEE ONV S
lOFK32-10B3 10 020S 030VV 4301331388 11482 FEE OVV S
WK3NSEN3-27A3 27 010S 030VV 4301331401 11686 FEE O\¾ S
HORROC‡092-5B1E 05 020S 010E 4304732409 11481 FEE CAN S
I-4RSEN1-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304730552 815 FEE OVV TA
DRYGULCH1-36A1 36 010S 0100/ 4304730569 820 FEE ONV TA
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