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Budget Bureau No. 42-R358.4.
Form Approved.

Form 9-8818
(Feb. 1951)

und Odice(SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE)
Lease No.

UNITED STATES Ret ash
--

- ( DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
GEOLOGICAL SURVEY

a a3 x
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

NOTICE OF INTENTIONTO DRILL---------------- --------.... __ SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF WATERSHUT-OFF.

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO CHANGEPLANS-----------. .. SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF SHOOTINGOR ACIDIZING

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO TEST WATER SHUT-OFF..._-_ SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ALTERINGCASING
NOTICE OF INTgNTION TO RE-DRILL OR REPAIR WELL.___ SUBSEQUENTREPORT OF RE-DRILLINGOR REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO SHOOT OR ACIDIZE-........-.... SUBSEQUENTREPORT OF ABANDONMENT

NOTICE OF 1NTENTIONTO PULL OR ALTER CASING -_. SUPPLEMENTARY WELL HISTORY._

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO ABANDON WELL

(INDICATE ABOVE BY CHECK MARK NATURE OF REPORT, NOTICE, OR OTHER DATA)

(23-868)
WellNo. is located1900 ft. from lineand ft. from line of sec. .

NB 1/4 W 1/4 26 78 838 SLBM

854 Wash Utatah Utah

Kany saahtus
The elevation of thexknialrdker above sea level is $555 ft. (estimated)

DETAILS OF WORK
(State names of and expected depths to objective sands; show sizes, weightsgand lengths of proposed casings; indicate mudding jobs, cement-

ing points, and all other important proposed work)

It is proposet to Art11 a test well for oil or gas to be completet in the lower
o.... mv.« ro..assen.
10•,¶/k" omaingto be oementet at g 280*.
'{" castag to be oemantet below louemanat prodnetime interval with aufttetent
oemant to weech4000*.

opet Green River - 2700*
"8" Point - 4600'
"K" Potat - $160'

y wou to twinaan to the First Salt 1963 Plaa of Sevelopmaat.
I understand that this plan of work must receive approval in writing by the Geological Survey before operations may be commenced.

Company __
_0518 07884_ CORRR A. AA$NNANY

Address EL 0. Box 495

Title Ho1A. Al artalmañann._
0808, 50•3 Gulf, Danser•1; Osulkine•¾; RLG•1; F11e•1

GPO



Budget Bureau No. 42-R350.
Approval expires 12-31-60.

UNITEDSTATES núaor E -

DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR I.EASE NUMBER. --

GEOLOGICÀLSURVEY UNTE----- 4... -- ---

LESSEE'S MONTHLY REPORT OF OPERATIONS

take ... .. ...--... .... County ........----M.----...... Field . --

The followiiegis a coriect report of operations and productio (inclicaling drillireg and producing

wells) for the neoreth o ---... J. ......., 1 . , -.........

.igeret's address 95 Correparey TAÊ ..GA a- kWÑAY

xxapst, Ist tasa r 187 Er 3e,a at, ma usant tonount aus A 5000-56* (ToesenL
a 5 50 saak f3 3800- ' (85 saahe, lans A 385•185'

lee ). ras a as mona , em Answa1<4;rear

25 e 26 78 3 )

: 5491*
.p# Jef see at 23L & 175 esekse ...sa as ssas soo....a

aa gotist 14.6 at 10soo P.x,
235 • et tag at13e* with175 seemsar 9 to . selanaltergerIna aat Maaro•

Boa #1 45 mia test. gra «msustately. Mate 7.4
er as te. mas, xa was,a sao,

935 8897¿ Mr * (53565 ) 40 at I teet. RW in 3 ata
aras asos, cr he er so, ra aseÂ

00-93301 testa a.e ass• em . measurest
r go; a er isto, a e, aar ¢¾ sato-ses4½ta ata. aate 3.5 aae ' water Paessaa nut R AB30r

§a, Sas,y 157) ra 2790. aan173 As 7"; A3#eastas to
586 a 500 4. «lest 44 5491*.

* As AMi l 3

Norm.-There were........ ...................,....x. ... runs or sales of oil; ..... . ........ ...... ...e_....__ M cu. ft, of gas sold;
.... .... .... ....... - runs or sales of gasoline during the month. (Write "no" where applicable.)

N TE.-Iteport on this form is required for each calendar month, regardless of the status of operations, and must be filed in
duplicate with the supervisor by the 6th of the succeeding month, unless átlierwise directed b the duperyisor.

iggg6 8 U. S. GOVÈRNMENT PRINTING OFFICE



Budget Bureau No. 42-R356.5

UNITEDSTATES UND OMCE ...

- · DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR LEASE NUMBER- ------

GEOLOGICALSURVEY UNIT .. ---- --- --- -------

rage two
LESSEE'S MONTHLY REPORT OF OPERATIONS

Utah Uintah Red Washßtate ... County ......... .. . Field .

The following is a correct report of operations and production (including drilling and producing

wells) for the month of .. ......

Feb
., 1Ë

P. O. Box 455 California 011 Co., Western Div.Agent's address _..... ........ - Company

Phone ... .. --.............. Agent's title .

F TWP. RANGE
O Pn a BABBEIa or OIL GalvlTY

E R O ÚSÚB)

NE W 26 78 23E 184 23• 3)

a t ions
SáV PETD: 5491·

: 0•3 4", •5#, 3955 esto at 231' C75 saoka )
", 3#, -55 catd et 5525' (500 saedra)

ti Ca 2dne
in . W. on worxover rig and ran Shlumbergar ganana collar and

t l>gs. Han I¾Cullough SL 5472 to 3100'. ßbot 1 way radial
ye ,1e at each t follovis g - 5533, 5365 5329-1/2, 5 , 1305, 5247,
94 and 51871. -oil tra ced g ar£s at 563* down " *(bing, with

, BF h/RC een+.inin 4,00>#20.40 ased and 25 AdomLte. Avg
to 7.5 PM fith 4000 pai. Fraced perta an $365' with same details as
33 . r ste 8 BPMwith ¾000psi. Selectively broke down ports $329•l/2,

310 and 5305' wi acit. F:aced perts 5329 1/2, 5310 and 5305' down 2•l/2"
uh 12,000 gal #5 RF, con*sining 12,tt00# 20- sand, (;00# Adamite.
Yg te 0.2 BPM th 4750 Isi. teidized attd f ports 5:347' with

#5 We tatning (,000#20-40 sanst and 2 Adamita. Avg rate
BP at 000 psi. Fraced perte at 5194 and 5187* 9-1/2' tubing with

0, s #i RT on+alming 12,003# 20•¾O atad and Adantite. Avg rate
RP wi 4950 ps . Ran prcduct,1xx tubinBs rods pump. ]Alag well on

et . %el et rig 2-12•63.

NE W 20 78 23E 188 (23- )

a †, Sions
p t 00 E PSTD: '

o-14", 10.5#, J->: esta at aaT• (17o sacks)
", 23#, ;955 enttat 569)* (500 satha)

* Coaductt 4
ed b .e to ß700'

. Er nachl mterger 108 and logs Ran DSI' #1 -

NOTE.-There were ....._..... ...._....--_-_.--...... runs or sales of oil; ...... _._ __ _ ___ _...._ _____ __.-...... M cu. ft. of gas sold;

....... runs or sales of gasoline during the month. (Write "no" where applicable.)
NOTE.-Report on this form is required for each calendar month, regardless of the status of operations, and must be filed in

duplicate with the supervisor by the 6th of the succeeding month, unless otherwise directed by the supervisor.
Form 9-829 16--25766-8 U. S. GOVERNf4ENT PRINTING OFFlcE(January



Form 9-830
NE U. S. LAND OFFICE -Sal†r Lalee--G&-ty

SERIAL NUMBER ..-
--------

LEASE OR ŸERMIT TO ŸROSPECT ------

7 UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY

LOG OF OIL OR GAS WELL
LOCATE WELL CORRECTLY

Company 9.41 ornig_ Oil oppg_y_,__Re.s.tBIR Ditklalress . _1..
O...Bo2LA.66--------------Vernal-,-Utah

Lessor or Tract E..og66 ..... _ _ _ _ _ __ .. ....... Field --Red -Wesh-------- State ------Utah---- --

Well No. .. o - 24- T- -76- R· - 23gleridian ·¯¯--SLBif--------..-.. County -----y gay-----

Location _ _ _19 t. of ..g- Line and gt. of ...y. Line of --¾¾--26---- ---_ _ _ Eleyatio

The information given herewith is a complete and correct record of the well and all wor one ereon
so far as can be determined from all available records.

Signed _ _g-.-R-- PETESON-------o
N

Date ----Maz'A-6r-1963----------------_ Title--Field- Superintendent
The summary on this page is for the condition of the well at above date.

Commenced drilling -..
_g..-....._ _ _ _ _-, 19..g Finished drilling F Nag 2 _ _ _ _ , 19

OIL OR GAS SANDS OR ZONES
(Denote gas by G)

No. 1, from ---6186------------ to -----Sig.-........ No. 4, from ----932 ---------- 619-- -

No. 2, from --52kg.... _... to _ _ _.gggg.. ....... No. 5, from .. -------. to $3 ß
No. 3, from-.5305._.. __.. to ---- $310---------. No. 6, from ... to

IMPORTANT WATER SANDS

No. 1, from.... . ..... ..... to -----...- _ _ _ _ .. .. No. 3, from .. .... to

No. 2, from .. .. . to ..... .... .... No. 4, from .. .-- to
CASING RECORD

renacd per Make Amount Kind of shoe Cut and pulled from
Fro

Perforated
Purpose

MUDDING AND CEMENTING RECORD

here set Number sacks of cement Method used Hud gravity Amount of mud used

321 27 Dieple éd
Di plauëd

PLUGS AND ADAPTERS

Heaving plug-Material
... Length . .. .. Depth set

Adapters-Mater1al
__ _ __ ___ Size e

SHOOTING RECORD

Size Shell used Explosive used Quantity Date Depth shot Depth cleaned



Where set Number sacks of cement Method used Hud gravity Amount of mud used

1 321 17 Diápláñëd
26 90 DI¾plaëëd

PLUGS AND ADAPTERS

Heaving plug-Material
.. - Length . Depth set

Adapters--MateriaL._..
_ _ _ _ _ Size
SHOOTING RECORD

Size Shell used Explosive used Quantity Date Depth sh Depth cleaned out

TOOLS USED

Rotary tools were used from --- ---. . feet to .. feet, and from ... . .. .. feet to - feet

Cable toolswere used from ... ... ...------ . feet to _ _ _ feet, and from ... -----. .. feet to - feet
DATES

-------- --¾ereh--9--------------, 194 Put to producing -----Mareh-27- -------..... , 19 .3.

SoPb
The production for the first 24 hours was . . barrels of fluid of which ..pg..% was oil .%

.L3 8 PD
emulsion; ..gg% water; and ..._ _% sediment. Gravity, °B é. ._ _ _ _ _ _ _.--g . ....

If gas well, cu. ft. per 24 hours ..... Gallons gasoline per 1,000 cu. ft. of gas ....

Rock pressure, Ibs. per sq. in. -......

EMPLOYEES
-------------Hank-¾oore_...... ---, Driller -- E Brüidy-------- , Driller

-------------C-;-Rv-Brandon-- -- , Driller . --. ..__-. ..-......... ., Driller
FORMATION RECORD

FROM- TO- TOTAL FEET FORMATION

O 2671 2671 Shale & Sand
2671 5526 2895 Sand & Shale

'IOR 2671 (/28h?)
G 4374 (fl'Ihh)

H h56h (/ 96h)

I h745 (/ 773)

J 5118 (/ hoo)

L 53k¶ (/ 173)

(OVERJ



WELL 0718¼ (23-26B} PROPERTY: SECTION26 RyWASWTIELD

HISTORYOF OIL OR GASWELL

Moved Signal Drilling Rig an$ rigged up. Spudded at 10:00 P. M. 1-h-63. Drilled 16"
hole to 236*. Set 10-3/h" casing to 230.880 with 17§ sacks regular cement, WOC12 hre.

January 5, 1963 - January 16, 1963
Drilled 9" hole to $526*. Ran Schlumberger IES and Micro-Caliper logs.

January 17, 1963
Ran DST #1 (Shh6-Sh62)h$ Min. test GTS 7.4 TICFD steady to end of flow period. Re-
covered 1* of Distillate. Pressures: IH - 2896, ISI - 1939, IF - 980, FF - 1160,
FSI - 1936, FH - 2835, DST #2 ($366-6372)60 Min. test. Strong blow (12"H20) in
2 Mins. GTS in 3 Min. TSTM/ Recovered 1h06 mud out oil. Pressuress IH - 2728,
ISI - 1605, IF - &O, FF - 60, FSI - 1684, FH - 2728. DST #3 ($300-9330)60 minute
test. NGTS recovered 289 mud dut, oil.. Pressures: IH - 28h0, ISI-1820, IF - 90,
FF - 126, FSI - 1670, FH - 28ho.

January 18, 1963
DST #h ($276.5284)h6 minute test. GTS in 2 min. rate: 3.5 WCFD. REC: 18 water.
Pressures: IH - 2830, ISI - 1600, IF - 360, FF - $26, FSI - 1579, FH - 2790.

January 19, 1963
Cemented 7't casing at $$26*with 600 eacks regular cewnt¿ Released rig at 6:00 P. M.

February 2y 1963
M ved in J. W. Gibson workover rig to co:aplete well.

February 3, 1963
Ran Schlumberger Gamma-Collar and Cement Bond Logsa

Februafy 4, 1963
Ran McCullough CBL $$72' to 3100*. Shot 1 $-wayRadial Super Jet at, each of the
following: $¼339,53669, $329þ, 63109,$3068,$2h7 ,

$19ht and $1878.

February 5, 1963
Sand-oil frac perfs et, 5433*down 2§* tubing with 6000Gals. #9 BF containing
4000#2040 sand, and 260# Adomite., Avg. rate - 7.6BPM with 6000psi.

February 6, 1963
Sand-Oil freced perfs at $3659, Down 2§¤ Tubing with 5000 Gals. BF #$/AC containing
h000#20/hO sand and 290# Adomite. Avg. Rate - 8 BPil vrith 5000 psi.

February 7, 1963
"roke down perfs.. at $329Šwith 150 Gals. acid. Broke down perfs. at $3108and$3099with 300 Gals.. acid. Sand-Oil freced per£e. at $329 63100, §3050, down
2)n tubing with 12,000 Gals. BF #$/RC containging 12,000# 20/40 sand, 600# Adomite
and 290# La T. Mothballs. Avg. rate: 10 BPMwith h760 psi.

February 8, 1963
Spotted 150 Gale, acid to perfs. at §2478. Sand-Oil fraced perfs at, 52479down
2gt tubing with 5000Gals. #$ BF containing 6000# 20/40 sand, and 290# Adomite.

Avg. rate: 7 BPMst 6000



Page 2

WELLNO. 18h (23-263) PROPERTY: SECTION26 RED WASHFIELU

February 9, 1963
Sand-Oil fraced perfs. at $19&*and $1879. Down 2¼" tubing with10,000 Gals.
#$ RF, containing 12,000# 20/h0 sand, and 500#Adomite. Avg. rater 9 BPMwith
h960 psi.

February 10, 1963
Rgn production string.

February 11, 1963
POOH with rods and pump. Removed safety Jt.

Februag 12, 1963
Ran pump and rods. Hung well on production. Released



WELL NAME:
Red Wash Unit #184 (23-26B)

FIELD:
Red Wash

PROPOSED PERFORATING PROCEDURE

1. Changes intended: Re-perforate and open new interval 5406-09.

2. Results anticipated: Increase production.

3. Conditions of well which warrant such work: Oil is being produced through

limited entry perforations.

4. To be ripped or shot: Shot.

5. Depth, number and size of shots (or depth of rips): 3 shots/ft.

5185-95, 5246-50, 5304-06, 5310-13, 5326-32,
5361-66, 5406-09, 5432-36

6. Date last Log of well filed:

7. Anticipated additional surface disturbances: None.

8. Estimated work date: July 15, 1977

9. Present production and status:

Date BOPD MCFD BWPD

5/77 34 22 19

TAM



Form 9-331 U ED STATES SUBMIT IN TRI ATE. Form approved.
(May 1963)

DEPARTMENT OF THE INŸfRI$R ve°rfe
sid

structions on re-
EAsm

ned a llureau No. 42--LR1424.

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY U-0566

SUNDRYNOTKES AND REPORTSON WELLS
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NANIE

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

1.

WE ,L
ESLL

OTHER

7. UNITRAGREENIENShNA31E

OPERATOR 8. FARif OB LEASE NAME

Chevron U.S.A. Inc. Red Wash Unit
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

P. O. Box 599, Denver, CO 80201 #184 (23-268)
4.¯Toi

rios oF «Et,L (Report location clearly and in accordance i any Sta e uirem 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
See also space 17 below.)
At suriace Red Wash Field

11. SEC., T., R., M., OR BLK. AND

1980' FSL & 1980' FWL (NE¼SN½;) S, ==v=To=&ass

S26, T7S, R23E, SLBM
14. PER311T No. 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whether vr, RT, GR, etc.) 12. COUNTY OR PARISH 13. STATE

KB 5517.54 Uintah Utah

16. OCk Appropriate BoxTo indicate Nature of Notice, Report,or OtherData
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO I SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF :

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PCLL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT X IIULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT 08 ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)
(NoTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well

(Other) Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE I'ROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of startingÅ
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this work.) *

It is proposed to perforate and do the following stimulation work to increase oil
production.

1. MIR. POOH w/rods and tubing.
2. RIH w/bit and scraper and clean out well to 5491'.
3. Perforate intervals 5185-5436'. See attached.
4. RIH w/RBP & Pkr. Swab test interval 5406-09. Evaluate to see if cement

squeeze is necessary.
5. Bradenhead frac down 7" casing using 60,000 gals K-1 Super Emulsifrac, 24,000#

100 mesh sand, 60,000# 20/40 sand, 18,000# 10/20 sand, and 800# Benzoic acid
flakes-napthalene mix.

6. RIH w/notched collar to clean out sand.
7 Place well on production.APPROVEÒY THE DIVISIONOEC1L, GAS, ND MINING 3 - USGS

DATE:
...

No additional surface
23

rtn'ers

BY: gisturbances requir#4 1 - JCB
·~~"'

-------------
.....-• £or gis ao gitLan 1 - DLD

1 - Prod Acetg Sec 723
1 - File

18. I hereby certify that the oregoing is true and correct J. J. Johnson

SIGNED TITLE Engineering Assistant y
|‡,77

(This space for Federal or State odice use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructionson Reverse



Form -331 UNI D STATES SUBMIT IN TRIPL E. Form approved.
( Iny 1963)

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Pr'sheesidstructions on re-
5. LEASE

DEdS
G AT

NNo. 42-R1424.

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY U-0566

SUNDRYNOTKES AND REPORTSON WELLS
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

1. ' 7. UNIT AG EEMENT NAME

OIL GAS
WEraL WELL OTHER Red Wash

2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FAR31 OB LEASE NAME

Chevron U.S.A. Inc.(~
ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

P. O. Box 599, Denver, CO 80201 184 (23-26B)
4. LOCATION OF WELL (RODOft IOCatiOn clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
At surface Red Wash

11. sac., T., R., M., OR BLK. AND
SURVEY OR AREA

1980' FSL & 1980' FWL (NEk SW¼) S26, T7S, R23E, SLBM

14. PERMIT No. 15. ELEVATIONs (Show whether DP, RT, GR, etc.) 12. COUNTY OR PARISH 13. STATE

KB 5517.54 Uintah Utah
16. CheckAppropriate BoxTo indicate Nature of Notice, Report,or OtherData

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT 07:

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT X ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIzz ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)
(NoTE : Report results of multiple completion on Wel

(Other) Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CO.ifPLETED OPERATIoNs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work, If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this work.) *

The following stimulation work was done on well:

1. MIR & RU. POOH w/rods, pump and tubing.
2. RIH w/bit and casing scraper. Cleaned out well to 5,486. POOH.
3. Perforated intervals 5185-5436. See attached.
4. RIH w/packer and bridge plug. Set packer at 5,373. Set plug at 5,414.

Swab tested zone 5406-09.
5. Pumped 250 gal 15% HC1 into formation and swabbed acid back.
6. Bradenhead frac down casing using 60,000 gals K-1 Super Emulsifrac, 24,000#

100 mesh sand, 66,000# 20/40 sand, 18,000# 10/20 sand, and 800# Benzoic acid
flakes-Napthalene mix.

7. RIH w/notched collar and cleaned out well.
8. RIH w/tubing, rods and pump. 3-USGS

9. Placed well on production. 2-State
3-Partners
1-JCB

No additional surface 1-DLD

disturbances required 1-Sec. 723
for this activity, 1-File

18. I hereby certify that the fpregoing is true and correct
J. J. Johnson

SIGNED
,

TITLE yptrinARrinR ASSìStant DATE Sept. 6, On

(This space for Federal or State ofBee use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse



(Iþ (Iþ
WELL NAME: Red Wash Unit #184 (23-268)

FIELD. Red Wash

COMPLETED PERFORATING PROCEDURE

1. Depth, number and size of shots (or depths of rips): 3 Shots per foot.

5189-95, 5246-50, 5304-06, 5310-13, 5326-32, 5361-66,
5406-09, 5432-36.

2. Company doing work: Oil Well Perforators

3. Date of work: August 26, 1977

4. Additional surface distrubances: None.

5. Production after work:

Date BOPD MCFD BWPD

9/4/77 106 117

JAM



Forn 9-331 Form Approved.

Dec. 1973 Budget Bureau No. 42-R1424

UNITED STATES 5. LEASE
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR U-0566

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY & IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UNIT AGREEMENTNAME

(Do not use this forrn for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different Red Wash
reservoir. Use Form 9-331-C for such proposals.) 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

1. oil gas
well well other 9. WELL NO.

2. NAME OF OPERATOR 184 (23-2 B
Chevron U.S.A. Inc. 10. FIELDORWILDCATNAME

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR Red Wash
P. O. Box 599, Denver, CO 80201 11. SEC., T., R., M., O BLK. AND SURVEY OR

4. LOCATION OF WELL (REPORT LOCATION CLEARLY. See space 17 AREA

below.) Sec. 26, T7S R23E i
'

AT SURFACE: 1980' FSL & 1980' FWL (NE SW) 12. COUNTYORPARISH 13. STATE .

AT TOP PROD. INTERVAL: Uintah Utah
AT TOTAL DEPTH: 14. API NO.

16. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE,
REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 15. ELEVATIONS (SHOW DF, DB AND WD)

KB 5517.5
REQUEST FOR APPROVAL TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:
TEST WATER SHUT-OFF
FRACTURE TREAT
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE

RORWEALLLTER
CASING APPROVEDBY T I

MULTIPLE COMPLETE L GAS, AND MINING
CHANGE ZONES

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERAT ONS Ciënt¶ydek '&ent- give pe es,
including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface ocations and
measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

It is proposed to clean out, acidize and fracture stimulate Jell a foll s:

1. MIR & RU. POOH w/rods & pump. ND tree. NU BOPE.
2. RIH w/bit, casing scraper & clean out to 5481. Circ hole clean. OOH.
3. RIH w/RBP, packelr & workstring. Acidize. See attached.
4. RU to braden head frac interval 5185--5436 down csg using K-1 Superemulsifrac

(60-70% oil & 30-40% wtr) (Rangely crude + 2% KCL), wtr gelling paent, 58,000
gals., 66,0,00# 20/40

.sand, 24,000#200 mesh sand & 18,000# 10/20 sanË
5. RIR w/notched collar to clean, out sand fill.
6. RTH-w/production - tbg anchor catcher, rods & pump. 3 - USG 1 - JCB
7. Place well on production. 2 State 1 Sec 723

3 - Partners 1 - File

Subsurface Safety Valve: Manu. and Type Set @ Ft.

18. I hereby ce if th the foregoing is true and correct

SIGNED TITLE Engineering Ass't.DATE October 9, 1979

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, 1F ANY:

No addiffonal surface
disturbances required
ÎOI' Ì¾iß SOÌìVi fe *See Instructions on Reverse



WELL NAME: Red Wash Unit 184 (23-26B)

FIELD: Red Wash

PROPOSED TREATMENT PROCEDURE

1. Objective: Increase production.

2. Size and type of treatment: 5406-36 1500 gals 7½% NE acid
5341-66 1750 gals 7¼% NE acid
5304-32 1400 gals 7½% NE acid
5246-50 200 gals 7½% NE acid

3. Intervals to be treated: 5185-95 500 gals 7¼% NE acid

4. Treatment down casing or tubing: Tubing.

5. Method of localizing its effects: REP, Packer and benzoic acid flakes to be used
as diverting agents.

6. Disposal of treating fluid: Spent acid will be swabbed back to flat tank.

7. Name of company to do work: Dowell, Halliburton or Western.

8. Anticipated additional surface disturbances: None.

9. Estimated work date: Oct. 24, 1979.

10. Present statue, current production and producing interval:

Date BOPD MCFD BWPD

9/79 16 7



SAND STORAGE
FRAC TANKS

*=

FRAC MASTER
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o
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EOUIPMENT LOCATlDN SCHEMATIC
FOR

RWU 184





FIELD NAME Red Wash

COMPLETED TREÀTMENTPROCEDURE
5406-36 1500 gaf3½% NE

1. Size and type of treatment: 5341-66 1750 gal 7½% NE acid
5304-32 1400 gal 7½% NE acid
5246-50 200 gal 7½% NE acid
5185-95 500 gal 7½% NE acid

2. Intervals treated:
5185-5436

3. Treatment down casing or tubing:
Tubing

4. Methods used to localize effects: RBP, packer and benzoic acid flakes to
be used as diverting agents.

5. Disposal of treating fluid: Spent acid will be swabbed to flat tank.

6. Depth to which well was cleaned out: 5481'

7. Date of work: 12/6/79 - 12/19/79

8. Company who performed work: Halliburton

9. Production interval: 5185 - 5436

10. Status and production before treatment:

Date BOPD MCFD BWPD

9/79 16 7 20

11. Status and production after treatment:

. Date BOPD MCFD BUPD

12/79 23



Form 9-331 Form Approved.
Dec. 1973 Budget Bureau No. 42-R1424

UNITED STATES 5. LEASE
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS I RNelAGaR MENT NAME
(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different
reservoir. Use Form 9-331-C for such proposals.) 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

1. on
e other 9. WELL NO.

2. NAME OF OPERATOR 184 (23-26B)
Chevron U.S.A. Inc• 10. FIELDORWILDCATNAME

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR
P.O. Box 599, Denver, CO 80201 11. SEC., T., R., M., OR BLK. AND SURVEY OR

4. LOCATION OF WELL (REPORT LOCATION CLEARLY. See space 17 AREA
below.) Sec. 27, T7S, R23E
ATSURFACE: 1980' FSL, 1880' FWL NESW 12.COUNTYORPARISH 13.STATE
AT TOP PROD. INTERVAL: Uintah Utah
AT TOTAL DEPTH:

14. API NO.
16. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, 43-047-05355

REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 15. ELEVATIONS (SHOW DF, KDB, AND WD)
KB 5518, GL 5505.5

REQUEST FOR APPROVAL TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:
TEST WATER SHUT-OFF
FRACTURE TREAT
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE
REPAIR WELL (NOTE: Report results of multiple completion or zone
PULL OR ALTER CASING change on Form 9-330.)
MULTIPLE COMPLETE
CHANGE ZONES
ABANDON*
(other Squeeze Cementing

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates,
including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and
measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

It is proposed to cement squeeze water producing zones as per attached
procedure.

-USGS

APPROVED BY THE STATE -state

OF UTAH DIVISION OF APRQ-

3-Partners

OILE:G N/

IL,
ING

1- eld Foreman

Subsurface Safety Valve: Manu. and Type Set @ Ft.

18. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct

SIGNED TITLE Engineering Asst. DATE March 29, 1982

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions an Reverse



RWU No. 184 (23-268)
CRD2-2770

-

WORKOVER JUSTIFICATION
March 10, 1982

The subject 5 Spot area well has been a prolific water producer for the past
two years. RWU No. 184 showed a dramatic response to the injection which began
in late 1979; production had increased five fold by May 1980. However, the
oil rate immediately began to decline rapidly while water production continued
to increase (see Figure One).

In December 1981, a fluid entry survey was run which clearly showed that the
KF and KD sands were watered out. This can be traced directly to three of the
four surrounding injectors where the KF sand is a thief zone as shown by
injection surveys.

Also, note Table One which shows a steadily rising fluid level and water cut
over the last ten months. It is believed that the rising fluid level killed
the KB sand which the fluid éntry survey showed to be the primary oil producing
interval. The fluid level continued to rise until late February when the well
started flowing on its own. It has been flowing since then at + 970 BWPD and
5 to 35 BOPD. At this rate, RWUNo. 184 is contributing one third of the
5-Spot area water production.

It is recommended that the KF and KD sands be squeeze cemented in No. 184 to
eliminate the high water production. While the cause of the high water production
is the poor injection profiles, the immediate solution is working on No. 184.
The surrounding injectors will be worked on in the near future. No other producers
which offset these injectors are experiencing WOR



RWU No. 184 (23-268)
RED WASH/MAIN AREA 5 SPOT
CRD2-1770

March 10, 1982

Location

NE¼SW¼, 1980' FSL, 1980' FWL, Section 26, T7S, R23E, Uintah Co., Utah
Lease No. U-0566, API No. 43-047-05355, KB=5518, GL=5SOS
TD=5526, PBTD=5491

Casing Detail

0.90 Baker GS
32.55 1 jt 7", 23 #/ft J-55 casing

1.40 Baker Flexiflo FC
5497.17 172 jts casing as above

- 6.02 above KB
5526.00

Tubing Detail

12.00 KB
5298.89 168 jts 2-7/8" 6.5 #/ft tubing

1.10 PSN
8.10 Sub
0.75 X-over

26.00 Pump 262 stage M-34
5.60 Seal

22.10 Motor
5374.54

Well History

02/63
Initial completion
1-5 way jet @ each of 5433, 5365, 5329, 5310, 5305, 5247, 5194, 5187
IP 188 BOPD, 21 BWPD

34/64
Frac above Latervals
Before: 14 BOPD, 2 BWP-D-- After: 74 BOPD, 13 BWPD

09/77 -

Perforate w/ 3 jets per foot and frac
5436-32, 5409-06, 5366-61, 5332-26, 5313-10, 5306-04, 5250-46,
5195-85
Before: 24 BOPD, 16 BWPD After: 60 BOPD, 52 BWPD
12/79
Frac existing perfs-
Before: 19 BOPD, 51 BWPD After: 34 BOPD, 121 BWPD



RWU No. 184 (23-26ß)
RED WASH/MAIN AËEA 5 SPOT
CRD2- 17/0

March 10, 1982
Page 2

Workover Procedures

1. MICR and RU as Denver Drilling specifies.

2. Kill well.

3. POOH w/ production string and pump.

4. RIH w/ RBP and PKR, isolate perforations 5332-26.

5. Pump into perforations 5332-26 to check for communication w/
5313-10/5306-04. -

6. POOH w/ retrievable tools.

7. If 5332-26 communicated w/ 5313-10/5306-04, squeeze cement all three
intervals. Otherwise, squeeze cement 5313-10/5306-04.

8. Squeeze cement 5250-46.

9. DOC, CIRS and CIBP.

10. RIH w/ production string and pump as Denver Engineering specifies.
Return well to



Fuam approved.

( em r 8 UN D STATES gig17 i x',",6, No il ) ( .<

(Formerly 9-331> DEPARTME , OF THE INTERIOR verse side) 1. LEASE DEHlnNATION AND SERIAL

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT U-0566 Ÿ0
0. IF INDIAN, ALI,OTTRE OR TRIBE NAtlF.SUNDRYNOTlŒS AND REPORTSON WELLS

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for auch proposals.) V VV

1. 7. UNIT AGREE.itENT NA31E
°w'r

r, O "A"ce ossen Red Wash
2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FARM OR IÆASE NAME

Chevron U.S.A. Inc.
3, ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

P.O. Box 599, Denver, Colorado 80201 184 (23-26B)
4. iÀióÄrloÑor well, (Regiort location clearly and in áceordance with a U. iffEi.6 ÀÑO P 01. tin n i rÁT

See also space 17 below )
at surrace i Red Wash Unit

1980 FSL 1880 FWL ÑA i¯ ï.ë. i;ii. caliis iriis
SURVET OR ARRA

NE SW .
DMSION OF Sec. 27 - T7S - R23E

xsuwxxx i: Invioss isew aata GAS &MINING 2 oliert an ins na
API # GL 5505.5 Uintah Utah

26 CheckAppropnate BoxTo indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
NOTICE F [NTENTION TO i 80118EQUENT REPORT Or :

TFST WATER SHUT-Olrir PI'I,I, OR AhTER r\SING WATER SHUTOFF REPAIRING WELI

PflACTURE TREAT All i.TIPI,E ('ONIPI.ETE FRACTI RE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

RIIOUT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT

ItEPAIII WELL CIIANGE PLAN? (Other)
tN TE: Report TPSUÌtSof multipicconipletion on WelllOther) Completion or Recon1pletion Report and Log form.)

17. DEscitruE vnnvasEn on costri.sTED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details. and give pertinent dates, including estimated-date of starting any
proposed wo:k. If well is directionally drilled. give subsurface locations and mensured and true vertical depths for all markers and mones perti-
nent to t.his work.) *

Operating necessity - wellhead packing started leaking.

Work Commenced 3/7/87
Propose to perform work as follows:

1. MIRU
2. Perforate tubing - roll hole with kill, weight mud.
3. POOHwith tubing and sub pump
4. Run Bit and scraper to 5454'.
5. RIH and set packer.
6. Test casing.
7. Install new wellhead equipment as necessary
8. RDMO 3 - BLM

3 - State
1 - EEM
3 - Drlg.
1 - File

18. I hereby cert tha r he or going true and correct
¯

S E 'TITLE CO E arch 1 1 87
(This spa for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE ACCEPTEEkBY THE STATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY: OF UTAH DIVISION OF

Federal approvaiof itäs OI , GAS, AND MINING
is requiredbefore commencing . T SE 97 n0ÑOrations, See lustructionson ReverseSide

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully o ke to an partment or ag ncy of the
United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any atter within its



( ett a r 183) UN STATES gagn I u "', s'
(Formerly 9-331> DEPARTMEN, DF THE INTERIOR verse sl< - ons.orms no -,«

. . ...

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT U-0566
6 in iúnili, ii.iorreii iE¥iiiiiii:

SUNDRYNOTIŒSAND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservolr 032405Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--' for auch proposals.)

7. UNIT AGREEMENT NA3tE

Chevron U. S. A. Inc. 23-26B
3. Anonr.as bir öFraixon 9. V:EI,I. NO.

P. O. Box 599, Denver, CO 80201 #184
4. I,o<iTros or «El.I, (Report location clearly and in accordance wÍ 6 nr S t OWOOMOF :o. »,.i.a iso ,«o,. as wo xar

also mee 17 below.)
O GAS &MINING Red Wash Unit

i 11. SEC., T., A., M., OH BI H. AND

1980 FSL, 1880 FWL (NE-SW) °"

Sec. 24, T7S, R23E
14. *ärwi = . in sis.varross ishow whether or, nT, on, etc.) 12. conNTY ott rantsu 13. BTATE

API 2 l'" Dill: 5505.5 GL Uintah Utah
26 CheckAppropriate BoxTo Indicate Nature of Notice, Report,or Other Data

NOTICE F INTENTION TO : 80HSICQUENT REPORT OF :

TI:ST WATEft SHUTOFF PI'I,i, OR AI,TER castNG WATER SHIJT-OFF REPAIRING Wlobi,

FRACTI RE TRFIAT ML I."'IPIÆ ('ON11'iÆTF: FRACTi HE TRICATMENT ALTICilfNG CASING

RiffroT GIt AflDIZF ABANI)ON* SHOOTING Ott ACIDI71NG ATIANDONMYNT

(NoTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well
(Other) r ' t'ornpytlon or Recolupletion Report apd Log form

17. la;scann: vnovosro on couri.E:TED oisitATrow tClenily st.ito all portinvilt tirtails. nii<1 glse pertinerti dates, Irleltiding estimated dnte of starting any
proposed wo:k. If well is directionally drilled. give subsurface locations anti measure<l and trtir verticul depths for all ularkers auti tones pertl
nent to this work.) *

The wellhead was repaired and well returned to production on 3-12-87 as follows:

1. Moved in Western Rig No. 18 3-8-87. Perforated tubing @ 5264' .

Circulated and killed well.

2. Nippled-up and tested BOPE.

3. POOH with sub-pump.

4. Made bit and scraper run - Run 'FH' packer. Attempt to set same at 5090' - Didn't set.

5. POOH with packer - Redress and run 'FH' packer to 5102' .

6. N/D BOPE - N/U tree - Displace annulus with corrosion inhibited fluid.

7. Drop Bell- Pressured packer and set same - Backsideepsi• 3 - BLM
3 - State

8. Open well and flow to battery - Release Rig• 1 - EEM
1 - JSL
1 - Sec.724-C
3 - Dr1g

18. I bereby cergf'y hatghe oregoin is true and correct

SIGNED TITLE Office Assistant DATE March 18, 1987

(This space for Federal or State ofBee use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructionson ReverseSide

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime tor any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the
United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its



Form approved.
Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135Form 3160-5 UNITEL' ATES SUBMIT IN TRIPLICAT Expires August 31, 1985ovembler Sa

DEPARTMENT O HE INTERIOR le°r'Aed
structions On

, LEASE DESIGNATION AND BERIAL NO.

BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT U-0566

SUNDRYNOTlŒS AND REPORTSON WELLS
6. R' INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TEIBE NAME

(Do not itse this form for propor,als to drill or to deepen or plug back to a di erent reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

1. 7, ÜNIT AGREEMENT NAME

°w'rec Ë °is
OTHEE Red Wash Unit

.
NAxx or oPraATon 8. FARM OB LEASE NAME

Chevron U.S.A. Inc., Room 13097 gy qqq Red Wash
3. ADDEESS OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

P.O. Box 599, Denver,~CO 80201 g RWU#184 (23-268)
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with a ts.* 10. rIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.) , ggAt BUrrace Red Wash - Green River
11. SEC., T., E., M., OR BLK. IND1,980 ' FSL (NE SW) = av== on Aa=a

1,980 ' FWL Sec. 26 T7S R23E
14. PenalIT No. 15. EI£VATIONs (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 12. COUNTY OR PAEISH 13. BTATE

/3 df?- ay GL: 5,506' KB: 5,518' Uintah UT

16· CheckAppropriate BoxTo Indicate Norureof Notice, Report, or Other Data
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBBEQUENT REPORT 07:

TEST WATER SHUT-Or, X PCLL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHOT-Orr REPAIEING WELL

FRACTUEE TREAT 3ICLTIPLE CO¾fPLETE FRACTUEE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIZs X sassoos• SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

nEPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)
(NoTE: Report results of multiple completion on

We1Ï¯
(Other) Completion or Recolapletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIO.NS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and r,ones perti-
nent to this work.) *

It is proposed to recomplete RWU#184 as follows:

1. Set BPV. MIRU, N/D wellhead. N/U & test Class III BOPE. Pull BPV.

2. Clean out paraffin plug in TBG.

3. POOHw/production string.

4. RU wireline unit. RIH w/ GR-junk basket to ± 5,300'. RIH & set CICR @ ± 5,290'.

5. RIH w/ bit & scraper to ± 5,290'.

6. RIH w/ RBP & PKR. Isolate perfs 5,185'-5,250' (Kg - KD) & acidize w/ 500 gal.
15% HCL, 250 gal. 2% KCLw/200# Baf & 500 gal. 15% HCL.

7. Swab test. 3-BLM
3-State

8. POOHw/tools. 2-Partners
1-EEM

9. RIH w/production equipment. 1-MKD
2-DRLG

10. RDMOL. 1-File
18. I hereby certif at t, e fo ego ng is de and correct

swan
,

/7N-- TITLE Technical Assistant 2-9-89

(This spaceMorFederal or Sta offlee use)

APPROVED BY - TITLE ACCEPTED BLBE STATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY: OF UTAH DIVISION OF

00 GAS, AND MININGFederalapprovalof this acaen
is requiredbefore4 *see Instructions on Revers id

2 4 ABŸ -

Title 13 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willful to make to any dep rtm t or agency of the
United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as any matter within its .1



Form approved.

oTefe°¯i'osa, UN'gnD STATES a vr rar ue p. ("
' «-oo oo oias

ormerly 9-331) DEPARTMEt WOF THE INTERIOR verserne>
" ¯wriistiaanx-as,

m,,o.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT U-0566 j
SUNDRY NOTlŒS AND REPORTSON WELLS

U AN, A LOW OR HIRE NAR

(Do not tuse this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

1 UNIT AGREEMENT Nast

°wÌLL A
.I, OTHER Red Wash Unit

hMecvron

U
Sa.

A. Inc . , Room 13097
eMdæWLash

3. Locarss or oPERATOR 9. wmLL No.

P. O. Box 599, Denver CO 80201 9 1 RWU #184 (23-268)
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with an tate requ re ents.* 10. rlELD AND POOL, OE WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
At surface Red Wash-Green River

11. szC., T., a., M., on BLK. IND
Ui GASå NIN saav.= oa -

1, 980 ' FSL & 1, 980 ' FWL NEk SW¼
Sec. 26-T7S-R23E

14. FEntitT No. 15. EL.EVxrloNs (Show whetber or, RT, GR, etc.) 12. COUNTY OR P&RISE 13. STATE

API 43-047-15290 GL: 5,506' KB: 5,518' Uintah Utah

Check Appropriate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Dato
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT 07:

TEST WLTER SHUT-GFF PCLL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHDT-OFF X arvatarna was:,

FRACTUEE TREAT 31ULTIPLE COMPLF.TE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

snooT on Acrozza AssNooN* smooTING on AcrottrNo ABANooNMENT*

REPAIR WEU, CHANGE PLANs (Other) I j
(NoTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well(Other) Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DEscainE rnOPOSED OR CO3tPLETED OPERATroNs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of att.rting u>y
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subaurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all mArkers and r,ones perti-
nent to this work.) *

RWU #184 was recompleted as follows:

1. RIH w/coil tbg unit . Clean out paraffin plug 148 '
-2, 550 '

.

2. MIRU Western 18 3/21/89. N/D WH. N/U & test BOPE.
3. POOH w/production string.
4. RIH w/bit & scraper & tag fill @ 5,426'.
5. Set CIBP @ 5,285'. RIH w/RBP & pkr.
6. Isolated perfs 5,185'-95' & 5,246'-50'. Acidized w/1,000 gals 15% HCL & additives.

Swabbed back load.
7. EOOR w/tools.
8. RIH w/production string.
9. N/D BOPE. N/U WH. 3-BLM

10. RIH w/pump & rods. 3-State
11. RDMOL 3/24/89. 2-Partners

1-EEM
1-MKD
2-Drlg
1-PLM
1-Sec. 724-C
1-Sec. 724-R

is. Ylireby cert t the fore oing true and correct

svasmo _ __ Trrra Technical Assistant pare 3-28-89

(Tbts spac or Federal or Sts.te ofBee use)

AFPROVED EY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructionson ReverseSide

fit.e 15 .S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any departmer.t or agency of the
United 5 ates any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction,



Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(June 1990) L. - TMENT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expkes. Mawh31, IW3

5. Lease Designation and SerialNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-os66

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--*for such proposalS 5. Iflndian, Allottee ornibe Name

N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICA TE ' """"°r ca, Agreement oesignation

1. Type of Well RED WASH UNIT

Well Well Other 8. Well Name and No,

RED WASH UNIT 184

2. NameofOperator

CHEVRON U.S.A. PRODUCTION COMPANY 9. APIWellNo.

3 Address and Telephone No. Steve McPherson in Red Wash (801) 781-4310 43-047-15290

11002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 or Gary Scott in Rangely, CO. (970) 675-3791 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well(Footage, Sec.,T., R., M., or Survey Description) RED WASH - GREEN RIVER

11. County or Parish, State

1980' FSL & 1980' FWL (NE SW) SECTION 26, T7S, R23E, SLBM UINTAH, UTAR

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, JR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans

Recompletion New Construction

O Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repä Water Shut-Off

O Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Cmion to on

Other ADDED PERFORATIONS Dispose water

(Note) Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log fonn.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work Ifwellis directionallydrilled,

give subsurface locations and measured and true verticaldepths for allmarkers and zonespertinent to this work)

1. MIRU. IIOT OIL AS NEEDED. TOH WITH RODS AND PUMP.
2. ND WH AND NU BOPE. RELEASE TUBING ANCHOR AND TOH.
3. MAKE BIT AND SCRAPER RUN IN 7" CASING TO 5273' PBTD.
4. PU RETRIEVABLE PACKER AND HYDROTEST IN HOLE TO ~3000 PSI. SET PACKER AT ~ 4300' AND PRESSURE TEST ANNULUS TO ~ 500 PSI.

5. PERFORATE THE FOLLOWING INTERVALS THROUGH TURING USING 4 JSPF, DECENTRALIZED, 0 DEGREE PHASING, MAXIMUM

AVAILABLE CHARGE. DEPTHS ARE FROM SCHLUMBERGER ELECTRIC LOG DATED 1/17/63.
4716-27' Hf
4707-10' Hf
4648-52' Hc
4584-88' Ha
4569-74' H
4441-46' . Gh
4402-08' Gc

6. SWAB/FLOW TEST AND EVALUATE. WELL MAY KICK OFF FLOWING BUT WILL REQUIRE ROD PUMPING IN THE NEAR FUTURE. PLAN ON

KILLING THE WELL AND RUNNING ROD EQUIPMENT.
7. RDMO. RETURN TO PRODUCTION.

14. l hereby certify thatthe foregoing is e and correct.
Signed G.D. SCOTT Title DRILLING TECHNICIAN Date January 26, 1996

(lhis space for Federalor State office use) Accepted by
Approved by: Tit¡e

Conditions of approval, if any

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States an goti au ulent statements or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See instruction on Reverse



rormalsoÎs UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

ouneisso) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March31, 1993

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-0566

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals 5. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICA TE 7. IfUnit or CA, Agreement Designation

1. Type of Well RED WASH UNIT

Well Wd Other 8. Well Name and No.

RED WASH UNIT 184

2. Name of Operator

CHEVRON U.S.A. PRODUCTION COMPANY 9. APIWeRNo.

3 Address and Telephone No. Steve McPherson in Red Wash (801) 781-4310 43-047-15290

11002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 or Gary Scott in Rangely, CO. (970) 675-3791 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4 Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) RED WASH - GREEN RIVER

11. County or Parish, State

1980' FSL & 1980' FWL (NE SW) SECTION 26, T7S, R23E, SLBM UINTAH, UTAH

12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, 3R OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans

Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

O Final Abandonment Notice Altm C Cmim to o

Other ADDED PERFORATIONS Dispose Water

(Note) Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearlystate allpertinent details, andgive pertinent dates, including estimated date ofstarting any proposed work. If well is directionallydrilled,

give subsurface locations and measured and true verticaldepths for allmarkers and zones pertinent to this work)

DATE OF WORK: 1/22/96 THRU 1/26/96
1. MIRU. HOT OIL AS NEEDED. TOH WITH RODS AND PUMP.
2. ND WH AND NU BOPE. RELEASE TUBING ANCHOR AND TOH.
3. MAKE BIT AND SCRAPER RUN IN 7" CASING TO 5269' PBTD.
4. PU RETRIEVABLE PACKER AND HYDROTEST IN HOLE TO 6000 PSI. SET PACKER AND PRESSURE TEST ANNULUS TO 500 PSI. OK.

5. PERFORATED THE FOLLOWING INTERVALS THROUGH TUBING USING 4 JSPF, DECENTRALIZED, 0 DEGREE PHASING, MAXIMUM

AVAILABLE CHARGE. DEPTHS ARE FROM SCHLUMBERGER ELECTRIC LOG DATED 1/17/63.
4716-27' Hf
4707-10' Hf
4648-52' Hc
4584-88' Ha NO SHOW OF GAS WHILE PERFORATING
4569-74' H
4441-46' Gh
4402-08' Gc

6. POOH WI PACKER, RIH W/PRODUCTION EQUIPMENT TO PUMP AND RETURN WELL TO PRODUCTION.
7. RDMO

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is e and correct.
Signed G.D. SCOTT Title DRILLING TECHNICIAN Date February 7, 1996

(Ibis space for Federalor State office use)

Approved by: Title Date

Conditionsofapproval,ifany

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makesit a crime for any person knowinglyand willfullyto make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or

representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

*See instruction on Reverse



vorm3160.9 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(June 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March31, 1993

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-0566

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals 5. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICA TE 7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

1. Type of Well RED WASH UNIT
Oil Gas

Well Wen Other 8. WellName and No.

REDWASH UNIT18423-268
2. NameofOperator

CHEVRON U.S.A. PRODUCTION COMPANY 9. API WellNo.

3. Address and Telephone No 43-047-15290
11002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 (801) 781-4300 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) RED WASH - GREEN RIVER
I l. County or Parish, State

1980' FSL& 1980' FWL(NESW)SECTION26, T7S,R23E,SLBM UINTAH, UTAH

12 CHECK APPROPRIATE 30X(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans

Recompletion New Construction

U Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection

Other TA STATUS FOR WELL Dispose water

(Note) Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinentdetails, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionallydrilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)

WE REQUEST A TA STATUS APPROVAL FOR THIS WELL.

WE PLAN TO RE-EVALUATE THIS WELL FOR POSIBLE FUTURE WATER INJECTION SERVICE.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Signed D. C. BEAMAN Titl© COMPUTER SYSTEMS OPERAOTR Date 3/18/1999

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Approved by: Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowinglyand willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or
representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

*See instruction on Reverse



06/03/97 DET A I L WELL D A T A menu: opt 00
api num: 4304715290 prod zone: GRRV sec twnshp range qr-qr
entity: 5670 : RED WASH UNIT/B GRRV 26 7.0 S 23.0 E NESW
well name: RWU 184 (23-26B)
operator: NO210 : CHEVRON USA INC meridian: S
field: 665 : RED WASH
confidential flag: confidential expires: alt addr flag:

* * * application to drill, deepen, or plug back * * *

lease number: U-0566 lease type: 1 well type: OW
surface loc: 1980 FSL 1980 FWL unit name: RED WASH
prod zone loc: 19 1980 FWL depth: proposed zone: GRRV
elevation: 5555' KB apd date: 621231 auth code:
* * completion in ormátion * * date recd: la/pa date:
spud date: 63 104 compl date: 630212 total depth: 5526'
producing interva s: 4402-5332'
bottom hole: 1 80 FSL 1980 FWL first prod: 630327 well status: POW
24hr oil: 211 24hr gas: 24hr water: 23 gas/oil ratio:

* * well c mments: directionl: api gravity: 27.00
901023 1989 CUM ADJ:930526 1991 CUM ADJ:

opt: 21 api: 43 4715290 zone: S20 date(yymm): enty



varmaisos UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
* ouneisso) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March31, 1993

5 Lease Designation and Serial No

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposalS 5 IfIndian, AllotteeorTribeName

N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICA TE 7 Ir unitor cA, Agreement oesignation
1. TypeofWell RED WASH UNIT

oil Gas I-SEC NO 761
Well well other MULTIPLE WELLS SEE ATTACHED LIST 8 Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator

CHEVRON U.S.A. INC. 9 API Well N
3. Address and Telephone No

11002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 (801) 781-4300 10 Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. LocationofWell(Footage,Sec,T,R,M,orSurveyDescription) REDWASH-GREENRIVER

11 County of Parish, State

UINTAH, UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice onntent Abandonment Change of Plans

Recompletion New Construction

Subyequent Report Plugging Back Non outine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

O Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection

Other CHANGE OF OPERATOR Dispose Water

(Note) Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form )

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work If well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)

As of January 1, 2000 Chevron U.S.A. INC. resigns as Operator of the Red Wash Unit.
The Unit Number is I-SEC NO 761 effective October 31, 1950.

The successor operator under the Unit Agreement will be
Shenandoah Energy Inc.
475 17th Street, Suite 1000
Denver, CO 80202

Agreed and accepted to this 29th day of December, 1999 RECE IVED
Shenando Ene

By: DEC3 0 1999
Solich

Presiden DIVISIONOFOlL,GAS&MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Signed A. E. Wacker Q _ g ,

6, Title Assistant Secretary Date 12/29/99

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Approved by: Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency ofthe United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements orrepresentations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See instruction on Reverse



Øivisionof Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH 4-KAS

2. CDW/ 5-S)Q
3. JLT 6-FILE

Enter date after each listed item is completed

X Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent

Operator Name Change (Only) Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 01-01-2000

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
CHEVRON USA INC SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC
Address: 11002 E. 17500 S. Address: 11002 E. 17500 S.
VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 VERNAL, UT 84078

Phone: 1-(435)-781-4300 Phone: 1-(435)-781-4300
Account No. NO210 Account N4235

CA No. Unit: RED WASH

WELL(S)
API ENTITY SEC. TWN LEASE WELL WELL

NAME NO. NO. RNG TYPE TYPE STATUS
RWU 190 (34-29A) 43-047-16500 99998 29-07S-22E FEDERAL IW PA
RWU 179 (43-33A) 43-047-15286 5670 33-07S-22E FEDERAL OW PA
RWU 192 (41-33A) 43-047-15294 5670 33-07S-22E FEDERAL OW P
RWU 178 (22-13B) 43-047-15285 5670 13-07S-23E FEDERAL OW TA
RWU 191 (12-27B) 43-047-15293 99998 14-07S-23E FEDERAL IW PA
RWU 194 (12-14B) 43-047-15296 5670 14-07S-23E FEDERAL OW P
RWU 189 (41-16B) 43-047-15292 5670 16-07S-23E STATE OW P
RWU 188 (23-20B) 43-047-15291 5670 20-07S-23E FEDERAL OW TA
RWU 180 (31-23B) 43-047-15287 5670 23-07S-23E FEDERAL OW TA
RWU 193 (43-24B) 43-047-15295 5670 24-07S-23E FEDERAL GW P
RWU 184 (23-26B) 43-047-15290 5670 26-07S-23E FEDERAL OW TA
RWU 19 (34-26B) 43-047-15148 5670 26-07S-23E FEDERAL GW P
RWU 176 (31-28B) 43-047-15283 5670 28-078-23E FEDERAL OW TA
RWU 177 (42-28B) 43-047-15284 5670 28-07S-23E FEDERAL OW TA
RWU 20 (41-29B) 43-047-15149 5670 29-07S-23E FEDERAL OW PA
RWU 181 (34-30B) 43-047-15288 5670 30-07S-23E FEDERAL OW P
RWU 186 (12-30B) 43-047-16499 99998 30-07S-23E FEDERAL IW PA
RWU 198 (21-33B) 43-047-15300 5670 33-07S-23E FEDERAL OW PA
RWU 196 (23-17C) 43-047-15298 5670 17-07S-24E FEDERAL GW P
RWU 195 (43-18C) 43-047-15297 5670 18-07S-24E FEDERAL OW PA
RWU 18 (41-19C) 43-047-15147 5670 19-07S-24E FEDERAL GW PA
RWU 197 (43-21C) 43-047-15299 5670 21-07S-24E FEDERAL OW PA
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 12-30-1999

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on:



3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 08-23-2000

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 224885

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: 02/04/2000

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator
for wells listed on: 02/04/2000

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Pro The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,

for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on:

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 09/18/2000

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 09/18/2000

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: N/A

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: N/A

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: 159261960

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed has furnished a bond: N/A

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on:

FILMING:
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on:

FILING:
1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:



United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

NCH 3 Utah State Office RECElVEDP.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

FEB07 2000
DIVISiON OF

\N REPLY REFER To OIL, GAS AND MININGUT-931

February 4, 2000
Shenandoah Energy inc.
Attn: Rae Cusimano
475 17thStreet, Suite 1000
Denver, Colorado 80202

Re: Red Wash Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

On December 30, 1999, we received an indenture whereby Chevron U.S.A. \nc. resigned as Unit
Operator and Shenandoah Energy Inc. was designated as Successor UnitOperator for the Red
Wash Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effective February 4,
2000. In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the
designated party has obtained all required approval that would entitle it to conduct operations
under the Red Wash Unit Agreement.

Your statewide (Utah) oil and gas bond No. 0969 willbe used to cover all operations within the
Red Wash Unit.

It is requested that you notifyall interested parties of the change in unit operator. Copies of the
approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriate federal offices, with one copy
returned herewith.

Sincerely,

Is/ Robert A. Henricks

Robert A. Henricks
Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure

cc: Chevron U.S.A. Inc.

bcc: Field Manager - Vernal (wlenclosure)
ivisionof Oil, Gas &Mining

Minerals Adjudication Group U-932
File - Red Wash Unit (wlenclosure)
MMS - Data Management Division
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron



e
Page No. 1
02/04/00 .

Well Status Report
Utah State Office

Bureau of Land Management

Lease Api Number Well Name QTR Section Township Range Well Status operator

** Inspection Item: 8920007610
UTUO566 4304715135 1 (41-26B) RED WASH NENE 26 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATEDUTUO82 4304715141 10 (12-23B) RED WASH SWNW 23 T 7S R23E OSI CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATEDUTUO559 4304715219 100A (43-21A) RED WA NESE 21 T 7S R22E WIW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATEDUTUO567 4304715220 101 (34-21B) RED WAS SWSE 21 T 7S R23E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATEDUTUO561 4304715221 102 (41-24A) RED WAS SENE 24 T 7S R22E WIW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATEDUTUO81 4304715222 103 (34-15B) RED WAS SWSE 15 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED

UTUO567 4304715226 108 (32-21B) RED WAS SWNE 21 T 7S R23E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATEDUTUO2025 4304715227 109 (21-28B) RED WAS NENW 28 T 7S R23E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATEDUTU0566 4304715142 11 (34-278) RED WASH SWSE 27 T 7S R23E WIW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATEDUTUO559 4304715228 110 (23-23A) RED WAS NESW 23 T 7S R22E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATEDUTUOS61 4304715229 111 (32-24A) RED WAS SWNE 24 T 7S R22E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATEDUTUOSS8 4304715230 112 (32-28A) RED WAS SWNE 28 T 7S R22E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED

UTUO2030 4304715233 115 (21-19B) RED WAS NENW 19 T 7S R23E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED

UTU0560 4304715236 119 (43-29A) RED WAS NESE 29 T 7S R22E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED

UTUO2025 4304715237 120 (23-288) RED WAS NESW 28 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATEDUTUO81 4304715238 121 (13-138) RED WAS NWSW 13 T 7S R23E PGW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATEDUTUO81 4304715239 122 (24-148) RED WAS SESW 14 T 7S R23E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED

UTUO2030 4304715242 125 (34-198) RED WAS SWSE 19 T 7S R23E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATEDUTUO560 4304715243 126 (41-29A) RED WAS NENE 29 T 7S R22E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATEDUTUO2030 4304715244 127 (12-198) RED WAS SWNW 19 T 78 R23E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED

UTUO81 4304715246 129 (14-158) RED WASSWSW 15 T 7S R23E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATEDUTUO81 4304715143 13 (14-228) RED WASHSWSW 22 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED

UTUO566 4304715250 133 (41-348) RED WAS NENE 34 T 7S R23E POW CHEVRONUS A'1NCORPORATED

UTUO2030 4304715252 136 (43-198) RED WAS NESE 19 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATEDUTUO2030 4304715253 137 (34-288) RED WAS SWSE 28 T 78 R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATEDUTUO2025 4304715254 138 (41-308) RED WAS NENE 30 T 78 R23E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED

UTUO81 4304715144 14 (14-138) RED WASH SWSW 13 T 78 R23E :WÌWSI CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATEDUT4081 4304715255 140 (24-228) RED WASSESW 22 T 78 R23E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATEDUTUO566 4304715256 141 (11-278) RED WASNWNW 27 T 78 R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED

UTü081 4304715257 143 (33-148) RED WASNWSE 14 T 7S R23E POW CHEVRONUS A



Form3160-5
- UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED

QÙne1990) RTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March3], 1993

5 Lease Designationand SerialNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-0566
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals 5 ff Indian, Allottee or TribeName

N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICA TE 7 It unitor cA, Agreement Designation

1. Typeofwell RED WASH UNIT
Oil Gas

Well Well Other 8 Well Name and No.

RED WASH UNIT 184 23-26B
2. Name of Operator

SHENANDOAH ENERGY, INC 9 API wellNo.

3. Address and Telephone No 43-047-15290
11002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 (801) 781-4300 10. Fieldand Pool, or ExploratoryArea

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) RED WASH - GREEN RIVER
I 1. County or Parish, State

1980' FSLet 1980' FWL(NE SW) SECTION 26, T75, R23E, SLBM UINTAH, UTAH

12 CHECK APPROPRIATE lOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OIL OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans

Subsequent Report PluggingBack Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair W¾hut-OŒ

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Cmiomo Igcuon

Other TA STATUS FOR WELL Dispose water

(Note) Report results of multiplecompletionon Well
Completion or RecomoletionReoort and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give peninent dates, includingestimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionallydrilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)

WE REQUEST A TA STATUS APPROVAL FOR THIS WELL.

WE PLAN TO RE-EVALUATE THIS WELL FOR POSIBLE FUTURE WATER INJECTION SERVICE.

RECElVED
APR17 2000
DIVISION OF

OIL, GAS AND MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoin is tru and correct.
Signed D. C. BEAMAN

'
Title OFFICE MANAGER Date 04/13/00

(This space for Federal or State officeuse)

App ehrtension for Shut-in or Temporarily Abandonment Way be issued, in accordance with Accepted bythe
Conditions of approval, if anyRfil^ F 7611, 1 9 et a upon receint and review, by the Division of Oil, Gas & Mining of LJtah ÛIVisÎ0It of

re e i IY10 or agency o false, fictitio u R&t Ilillig

*See instruction on Reverse



Page No. 2
02/04/00

Well Status Report

Utah State Office

Bureau of Land Management

Lease Api Number Well Name QTR Section Township Range Well Status Operator

UTUOl16 4304715258 144 (21-18B) RED WAS NENW 18 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTUO81 4304715259 145 (24-13B) RED WAS SESW 13 T 78 R23E OSI CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
uiúül.¯9 4304710492 140 t £18) adv wao awNw ci i to Kat F+a únivKuis uo a useu uma(Eu
UTUO81 4304715260 147 (22-22B) RED WAS SENW 22 T 7S R23E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTUO81 4304715261 148 (13-22B) RED WAS NWSW 22 T 7S R23E WIW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTUO571 43047152 2 14î (21 3]n) i:D na3 NEdw ]3 Y To x¿¿l- F+R UNLVKUN US A INLURFURAltU
UTUO2148 4304715145 15 (32-170) RED WASHSWNE 17 T 7S R24E PGW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTUO81 4304715263 150 (31-22B) RED WAS NWNE 22 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTUO81 4304715264 151 (42-14B) RED WAS SENE 14 T 7S R23E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTüûliáû 430471 193 152 (41 170) RED Wa3 klac 17 I 73 R~AC F.a C:2nGi - 3 a IWCORPORn:Cü
UTUO2025 4304715265 153 (14-298) RED WAS SWSW 29 T 7S R23E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED

UTUO81 4304715267 156 (23-15B) RED WAS NESW 15 T 75 R23E WIW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTUO2025 4304715268 158 (32-308) RED WAS SWNE 30 T 7S R23E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED

UTUO2030 4304716475 16 (43-28B) RED WASH NESE 28 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTUO81 4304715270 160 (32-158) RED WAS SWNE 15 T 7S R23E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTUO2030 4304715271 161 (14-20B) RED WAS SWSW 20 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTUO2030 4304715272 162 (12-20B) RED WAS SWNW 20 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED

UTUO2025 4304715274 164 (12-28B) RED WAS SWNW 28 T 7S R23E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTUOS66 4304715275 165 (32-26B) RED WAS SWNE 26 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED

UTUO567 4304715277 167 (23-218) RED WAS NEsW 21 T 7s R23E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTUO82 4304715278 168 (23-24B) RED WAS NESW 24 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTUO569 4304715146 17 (41-20B) RED WASH NENE 20 T 7S R23E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTUO81 4304716495 170 (41-15B) RED WAS NENE 15 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED

UTUO2030 4304715280 172 (21-30B) RED WAS NENW 30 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTUO569 4304716496 173 (21-21B) RED WAS NENW 21 T 7s R23E WIW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTUO933 4304715281 174 (21-208) RED WAS NENW 20 T 7S R23E WIW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED

UTUO2030 4304715283 176 (31-28B) RED WAS NWNE 28 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTUO2030 4304715284 177 (42-28B) RED WASSENE 28 T 7S R23E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTUO81 4304715285 178 (22-138) RED WAS SENW 13 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED

UTUO82 4304715287 180 (31-23B) RED WAS NWNE 23 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTUO2025 4304715288 181 (34-30B) RED WAS SWSE 30 T 7S R23E POW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTUO933 4304716497 182 (14-218) RED WAS SWSW 21 T 7s R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTUO81 4304715289 183 (33-138) RED WASNWSE 13 T 7S R23E WIW CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTUO566 4304715290 184 (23-268) RED WAS NESW 26 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTUO81 4304716498 185 (41-148) RED WAS NENE 14 T 7S R23E WIWSI CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED

UTUO2030 4304715291 188 (23-208) RED WAS NESW 20 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
STATE 4304715292 189 (41-168) RED WASNENE 16 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRONUS A INCORPORATED
UTU0566 4304715148 19 (34-268) RED WASHSWSE 26 T 78 R23E GSI CHEVRONUS A



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET l. GLH

2. CDW
3. FILE

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent/Operator

X Operator Name Change Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 2/1/2003
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N4235-Shenandoah Energy Inc N2460-QEP Uinta Basin Inc

11002E 17500S 11002E 17500S
Vernal, UT 84078-8526 Vernal, UT 84078-8526

Phone: (435) 781-4341 Phone: (435) 781-4341

CA No. Unit: RED WASH

WELL(S)
NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL Confid

NO TYPE TYPE STATUS

RWU 204 (23-25A) 25 070S 220E,4304715305 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 192 (4l-33A) 33 070S 220E 4304715294 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 178 (22-l3B) 13 070S 230E 4304715285 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 194 (12-14B) 14 070S 230E 4304715296 5670 Federal OW S
RWU 162 (12-20B) 20 070S 230E 4304715272 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 188 (23-20B) 20 070S 230E 4304715291 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU l67 (23-21B) 21 070S 230E 4304715277 5670 Federal OW S
RWU 180 (31-23B) 23 070S 230E 4304715287 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU l68 (23-24B) 24 070S 230E 4304715278 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 193 (43-24B) 24 070S 230E 4304715295 5670 Federal GW S
RWU 165 (32-26B) 26 070S 230E 4304715275 5670 Federal GW TA
RWU 184 (23-26B) 26 070S 230E 4304715290 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 19 (34-26B) 26 070S 230E 4304715148 5670 Federal GW TA
RWU 164 (12-28B) 28 070S 230E 4304715274 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 176 (31-28B) 28 070S 230E 4304715283 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 177 (42-28B) 28 070S 230E 4304715284 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 172 (21-30B) 30 070S 230E 4304715280 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 181 (34-30B) 30 070S 230E 4304715288 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 196 (23-17C) 17 070S 240E 4304715298 5670 Federal GW S
RWU 201 (32-28C) 28 070S 240E 4304715302 5670 Federal GW P

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2003

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2003

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/19/2003

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 5292864-0151

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

QEP LJB 15 FORM
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6. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: 7/21/2003

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 7/21/2003

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,
for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: n/a

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 8/28/2003

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 8/28/2003

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: n/a

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: n/a

STATE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965-003-032

FEDERAL WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024

INDIAN WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 799446

FEE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965-003-033

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
The Division sent response by letter on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS:

QEP UB 15 FORM



tar Exploration and Production Company

1050

1endenceetlazauite

500
Denver, CO 80265

Tel 303 672 6900 • Fax 303 294 9632

Denver Division

May 28, 2003

Division of Oil, Gas, & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P. O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Attention: JohnBaza/JimThompson

Gentlemen:

This will serve as notice that through the internal corporate changes described below,
activities formerly conducted in the name of either Shenandoah Operating Company, LLC
(SOC) and/or Shenandoah Energy, Inc. (SEI) will hereaftet be conducted in the name of
QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.: i) the Shenandoah entities were purchased in July,2001 by Questar
Market Resources, Inc., which is a mid-level holding company for the non-utility businesses
of QuestarCorporation, ii) Shenandoah Operating Company, LLC has now been merged
into Shenandoah Energy, Inc. (SEI), iii) Shenandoah Energy, Inc. has now been re-named
QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. pursuant to a State of Delaware Amended and Restated Certiñcate
of Incorporation, iv) the same employees will continue to be responsible for operations of
the former SOC and SEI properties, both in the field and in the office. Accordingly, the
change involves only an internal corporate name change and no third party change of
operator is involved. Please alter your records to reflect the entity name change. Attached is
a spreadsheet listing all wells affected by this change.

Should you have any questions, please call me at 303 - 308-3056.

Yours truly,

rank Nielsen
Division Landman

Enclosure RECEIVED
JUNO? 2003

DW OF DE GAS &



El (N4235) to QEP (N2460) RED WASH UNIT

well_name Sec T R api Entity Lease Type type
REDM/ASH22-21B 21 070S 230E 4304733522 5670 Federed OVV TA
RED VVAJSH24-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733523 5670 Federed OAV P
RED WASH 305 (41-4F) 04 080S 240E 4304732538 | 5670 Federal GW TA
REDMIASH306 23 070S 240E 4304732629

'
5670 Federal GVV P

RED VVAdsH44-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733524 5670 Federed O'N P
RED VVAJSH44-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733525 5670 Federal CAV P
RVVU1(41-26B) 26 070S 230E 4304715135 5670 Federal ONV TA I

RVVU101(12-23B) 23 070S 230E 4304715141 5670 Federal ONV TA
FUNU101(34-21B) 21 070S 230E 4304715220 5670 Federal CAW P
RYVU103(34-15B) 15 070S 230E 4304715222 5670 Federed OVV P
RVVU108(32-21B) 21 070S 230E 4304715226 5670 Federed ONV P
RVVU109(21-28B) 28 070S 230E 4304715227 5670 Federed OYV P
RVVUll0(23-23A) 23 070S 220E 4304715228 5670 Federal ONV P
RYVU lll(32-24A) 24 070S 220E 4304715229 5670 Federal ONV TA
FUNU 112 (32-28A) 28 070S 220E 4304715230 5670 Federal CAW P
RMRJ 115 (21-19B) 19 070S 230E 4304715233 5670 Federal. _OY/ P
RYVU 119(43-29A) 29 070S 220E 4304715236 5670 Federed OYV P
RVVU120(23-28B) 28 070S 230E 4304715237 5670Federed OYV TA
RVVU12l(13-13B) 13 070S 230E 4304715238 5670Federed GVV P
RVVU 122(24-14B) 14 070S 230E 4304715239 5670Federal ONV P
RVVU125(34-19B) 19 070S 230E 4304715242 5670 Federal ONV TA
RVVU 126(41-29A) 29 070S 220E 4304715243 5670 Federal OYV P
FDASJ127(12-19B) 19 070S 230E 4304715244 5670 Federal CA¥ TVs
RAVU129(14-15B) 15 070S 230E 4304715246 5670 Federal CDA' P
FUNU13 (14-228) 22 070S 230E 4304715143 5670 Federal CAW Tyr
FDARJ133 (41-34B) 34 070S 230E 4304715250 5670 Federal CON P
FDARJ136(43-19B) 19 070S 230E 4304715252 5670 Federal COW T7e
R3VIJ 137(34-28B) 28 070S 230E 4304715253 5670 Federal GMT T7e
RV U 138(41-30B) 30 070S 230E 4304715254 5670 Fedend ONV P
FDASJ140(24-22B) 22 070S 230E 4304715255 5670 Federal CON P
R3WU141(ll-27B) 27 070S 230E 4304715256 5670 Federal OM' TA
RVŒU143(33-14B) 14 070S 230E 4304715257 5670 Fedend ONV P
FDASJ144(21-18B) 18 070S 230E 4304715258 5670 Federal CA¥ T7e
RTVU145(24-13B) 13 070S 230E 4304715259 5670 Federed ONV TA
FDA1] 147(22-22B) 22 070S 230E 4304715260 5670 Federal CAN IVe
RTVU 15(32-l7C) 17 070S 240E 4304715145 5670 Fedend ONV P
RMSJ 151(42-14B) 14 070S 230E 4304715264 5670 Federal CON P
FDASJ153 (14-298) 29 070S 230E 4304715265 5670 Federal COW P
RMSJ 158 (32-30B) 30 070S 230E 4304715268 5670 Federal CON P
RTVU 160(32-l5B) 15 070S 230E 4304715270 5670 Federal ONV P
FDA'U162(12-20B) 20 070S 230E 4304715272 5670 Federal CAN TYL

RYŒU164(l2-28B) 28 070S 230E 4304715274 5670 Federal ONV P
RMRJ165 (32-26B) 26 070S 230E 4304715275 5670 Federal CPN Tyr
RTVU 167(23-21B) 2l 070S 230E 4304715277 5670 Federed ONV S
RNVU168(23-24B) 24 070S 230E 4304715278 5670 Federed ONV Tyr
RTVU172(21-30B) 30 070S 230E 4304715280 5670 Federal ONV TVs
RYŒU176(31-28B) 28 070S 230E 4304715283 5670 Federed ONV TA
RTVU177(42-28B) 28 070S 230E 4304715284 5670 Federed ONV TYL

R3¥U 178 (22-13B) 13 070S 230E 4304715285 5670 Federal CDA' TA
RVVU 180(31-23B) 23 070S 230E 4304715287 5670 Federed ONV TA
R3VU 181(34-30B) 30 070S 230E 4304715288 5670 Federal O'N P
RMAJ184(23-26B) 26 070S 230E 4304715290 5670 Federal OMT TT=
RVVU188(23-20B) 20 070S 230E 4304715291 5670 Federed ONV T7e
RVVU19(34-26B) 26 070S 230E 4304715148 5670 Federed CAV TVs
R'NU 192 (41-33A) 33 070S 220E 4304715294 5670 Federal O'N P
RVVU193(43-24B) 24 070S 230E 4304715295 5670 Federal GAV S
R'NU 194(12-14B) 14 070S 230E 4304715296 5670 Federal OiV S
RVVU196(23-17C) 17 070S 240E 4304715298 5670 Federal GVV S
RVVU201(32-28C) 28 070S 240E 4304715302 5670 Federed GAV P
RTVU204(23-25A) 25 070S 220E 4304715305 5670 Federal ONV P
RYVU205(23-21C) 21 070S 240E 4304715306 5670 Federal GVV TA
RYVU207 17 070S 230E 4304732738 5670 Federal ONV P
RYVU21(32-l4B) 14 070S 230E 4304715150 5670 Federal OVV P
R\VU 212 (41-8F) 08 080S 240E 4304720014 5670 Federal GM' P
RY/U21-24A 24 070S 220E 4304733592 5670 Federal ONV P

o&gcbsoded i



(N4235) to QEP (N2460) RED WASH UNIT

we11_name api type stat
RY/U21-25A 25 070S 220E 4304733576 5670Federal OVV P
R\VU 219 (44-21C) 21 070S 240E 4304730149 5670 Federal G\V P
RVVU220(22-23B) 23 070S 230E 4304730192 5670 Federed CAV Tyr
RVVU221(13-27B) 27 070S 230E 4304730199 5670 Federal ONV TA
RYVU22-lLA 13 070S 220E 4304733765 5670 Federal OYV S
RM'U22-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733559 5670 Federal OAV P
RYVU222(31-27B) 27 070S 230E 4304730200 5670 Federed GVV TA
RVVU22-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733491 5670 Federed CAV P
RINU22-25A 25 070S 220E 4304733786 5670 Federal O'N P
RVVU22-29B 29 070S 230E 4304733766 5670 Federed CAV S
RVVU224(44-22B) 22 070S 230E 4304730202 5670 Federed GNV 17e
RYVU225(13-23B) 23 070S 230E 4304730212 5670 Federal GVV TVs
R'NU 226(24-23B) 23 070S 230E 4304730249 5670 Federal GVV S
R'ARJ227 (14-26B) 26 070S 230E 4304730257 5670.Federal OiV TA
R'NU 228 (21-34B) 34 070S 230E 4304730258 5670|Federal ONV P
RM'U229(43-26B) 26 070S 230E 4304730259 5670 Federed OVV TYL

R'NU 230(14-18C) 18 070S 240E 4304730309 5670 Federal OAV TA
R3WU231(21-35B) 35 070S 230E 4304730310 5670 Federal CI'N 04
FUNU232 (12-26B) 26 070S 230E 4304730311 5670 Federal OAV 104
FDASJ23-24A 24 070S 220E 4304733567 5670 Federal O3W P
R'ASJ 233 (12-25B) 25 070S 230E 4304730312 5670 Federal OAV TVs
R\VU234(32-24B) 24 070S 230E 4304730313 5670 Federal OAV P
RTVU235(34-18C) 18 070S 240E 4304730314 5670 Fedeñd ONV P
FDARJ236 (21-19C) 19 070S 240E 4304730340 5670 Federal GAV P
RYVU237(14-25B) 25 070S 230E 4304730341 5670 Federed ONV P
RTVU238(32-35B) 35 070S 230E 4304730342 5670 Federal CAV Tys
RTVU239(41-35B) 35 070S 230E 4304730343 5670 Federed OVV Tys
RTVU24(34-14B) 14 070S 230E 4304715152 5670 Fedend O'N P
FDARJ240(l2-36B) 36 070S 230E 4304730344 5670 Federal O'N P
FURRJ241(22-14B) 14 070S 230E 4304730345 5670 Federed ONV P
RVVU24-18B 18 070S 230E 4304733554 5670 Federed ONV P
R'ASJ 24-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733492 5670 Federal O3N P
RVVU242(42-13B) 13 070S 230E 4304730346 5670 Federal ONV P
RTVU243(42-18C) 18 070S 240E 4304730347 5670 Federal ONV TVE
RYVU244(23-19C) 19 070S 240E 4304730348 5670 Federal GLNV P
Ifn1J246(22-18C) 18 070S 240E 4304730387 5670 Federed ONV P
R'ASJ247(22-l7C) 17 070S 240E 4304730388 5670 Federal GAV P
RTVU26(23-22B) 22 070S 230E 4304715153 5670 Fedend ONV TY,
R'NU262 (22-26B) 26 070S 230E 4304730517 5670 Federal (Tw' 114
R'ARJ265 (44-26B) 26 070S 230E 4304730520 5670 Federal GMT P
R'A'U267(32-17B) 17 070S 230E 4304732981 5670 Federal CAW P
IfWRJ27(43-14B) 14 070S 230E 4304715154 5670 Federed ONV TA
RTVU270(22-35B) 35 070S 230E 4304731082 5670 Fedentl ONV P
FDASJ272(44-23B) 23 070S 230E 4304731054 5670 Federal Cin' P
FURAJ273 (42-27B) 27 070S 230E 4304731051 5670 Federal O'N 114
RTVU276(44-27B) 27 070S 230E 4304731053 5670 Fedend CAV Tys
FDARJ278(11-26) 26 070S 230E 4304731076 5670 Federal G3N TA
RTVU28(43-22B) 22 070S 230E 4304715155 5670 Federed CAV P
R'ASJ280(ll-35B) 35 070S 230E 4304731079 5670 Federed O·3V P
RTVU282(42-26B) 26 070S 230E 4304731080 5670 Federed GNV TA
RSVU284(33-23B) 23 070S 230E 4304731476 5670 Federed G,¿r Ty,
R'ARJ285 (11-248) 24 070S 230E 4304731477 5670 Federal O'N P
FUNU286(42-21B) 21 070S 230E 4304731478 5670 Federal O'N P
RINU287(44-13B) 13 070S 230E 4304731512 5670 Federal C)'N TA
FUNU288 (24-27) 27 070S 230E 4304731513 5670 Federal O'N Tyr
RTVU289(13-24B) 24 070S 230E 4304731517 5670 Federed OVV P
RNVU29(32-23B) 23 070S 230E 4304715156 5670 Federed CAV P
R3VU292 (42-238) 23 070S 230E 4304731576 5670 Federal G3V TVs
RYVU293 (22-22A) 22 070S 220E 4304731581 5670 Federed ONV TA
RVVU294(24-18C) 18 070S 240E 4304731582 5670 Federed GNV P
FDASJ295(ll-22B) 22 070S 230E 4304731577 5670 Federal GB¥ T),
RTVU296(12-35B) 35 070S 230E 4304731578 5670 Federed ONV P
RTVU297(24-I5B) 15 070S 230E 4304731579 5670 Federed ONV P
RVVU298(22-27B) 27 070S 230E 4304731679 5670 Federed ONV TA
RYVU299(32-18B) 18 070S 230E 4304733018 5670 Federal ONV P
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l (N4235) to C)EP (N2460) RED WASH UNIT

wel1_name ec T R api Entity Lease Type type stat

RYVLl3 (34-23B) 23 070S 230E 4304715136 5670 Fedenil O\V P
RIA'U 30(23-13B) 13 070S 230E 4304715157 5670 Federal GAV Tys
RYVU301(43-15B) 15 070S 230E 4304731682 5670 Fedend ÒYV S
R\VU 302 (22-24B) 24 070S 230E 4304731683 5670 Federal GAV T),
RTVU303 (34-17B) 17 070S 230E 4304731819 5670 Fedend CiV P
R1A'U31(34-22B) 22 070S 230E 4304715158 5670 Federal OAV P
RYVU33(14-14B) 14 070S 230E 4304715160 5670 Fedend GYV TA
RVVU35(43-13B) 13 070S 230E 4304715162 5670 Federal ONV Tys
RAVU36(32-13B) 13 070S 230E 4304715163 5670 Fedend GNV P
RA43J38 (14-23B) 23 070S 230E 4304715165 5670 Federal O\V P
RVVU39(14-24A) 24 070S 220E 4304715166 5670 Fedend OYV Tyr
RAA'U4(41-22B) 22 070S 230E 4304715137 5670 Federal OAV Tyr
R'NU40(21-24B) 24 070S 230E 4304715167 5670 Fedend OAV 17e
R341J41(34-13B) 13 070S 230E 4304715168 5670 Federal OiV P
RM'U41-24A 24 070S 220E 4304733769 5670 Federal OVV P
RYVU41-25A 25 070S 220E 4304733579 5670 Federal O'N P
RAVU42 (21-29C) 29 070S 240E 4304715169 5670 Federal GlA' P
RA41J42-19B ,19 070S 230E 4304733556 5670 Federal OAV P
P343J42-20B

,20 070S 230E 4304733490 5670 Fedend OAV P
RTVU42-24A 24 070S 220E 4304733569 5670 Federal CAV P
RTVU42-25A 25 070S 220E 4304733580 5670 Fedend CAV S
RAArU42-30B 30 070S 230E 4304733771 5670 Federal OiV P
RAVU43(12-17B) 17 070S 230E 4304715170 5670 Federal OiV P
R'NU44(32-33C) 33 070S 240E 4304715171 5670 Federal GAV P
R'ARJ44-18B ;18 070S 230E 4304733594 5670 Fedend CAV P
FURAJ44-30B 30 070S 230E 4304733772 5670 Federal CAV P
RNVU45(23-30B) 30 070S 230E 4304715172 5670 Fedend ONV Tyr
RNVU46(41-21C) 21 070S 240E 4304715173 5670 Fedend GNV Tyr
RWU 49 (12-29B) 29 070S 230E 4304715175 5670 Federal OW TA
RVŒU5(41-23B) 23 070S 230E 4304715138 5670 Federal ONV P
FERRJ50(14-:23A) 23 070S 220E 4304715176 5670 Federal OAV P
Fühi) 52(14-18B) 18 070S 230E 4304715178 5670 Federal OAV Tyr
IfnSJ 53 (41-25A) 25 070S 220E 4304715179 5670 Federal OAV Tyr
FinSJ 57(12-18C) 18 070S 240E 4304715183 5670 Federal OAV P
RTVU63 (21-22B) 22 070S 230E 4304715186 5670 Fedend GNV TYL

R'ARJ64(32-27B) 27 070S 230E 4304715187 5670 Federal OAV T,4
R'N1U66(34-18B) 18 070S 230E 4304715189 5670 Federal OAV P
R1ARJ67(42-22B) 22 070S 230E 4304715190 5670 Federal OAV TA
R'ARJ69(2l-27B) 27 070S 230E 4304715191 5670 Federal OAV T7e
RTVU70(23-22A) 22 070S 220E 4304715192 5670 Fedend CAV P
R'A1] 7l (21-18C) 18 070S 240E 4304715193 5670 Federal OAV P
R'ARJ72 (23-27B) 27 070S 230E 4304715194 5670 Fedenil OAV Tyr
RVVU74(12-13B) 13 070S 230E 4304715196 5670 Fedend GYV P
R'ARJ 75 (21-26B) 26 070S 230E 4304715197 5670 Fedend OAV Tyr
RVVU76(32-l8C) 18 070S 240E 4304715198 5670 Fedend GVV S
R'ARJ77 (21-13B) 13 070S 230E 4304715199 5670 Fedend OAV P
R'ASJ78 (32-28B) 28 070S 230E 4304715200 5670 Fedend OiV P
RSVU79(12-27B) 27 070S 230E 4304715201 5670 Fedentl ONV T7e
RTVU8(32-22B) 22 070S 230E 4304715139 5670 Fedend ONV P
RV U80(14-27B) 27 070S 230E 4304715202 5670 Federed OVV P
R'ARJ81 (41-31B) 31 070S 230E 4304715203 5670 Federal O\V P
R'ASJ83 (41-27A) 27 070S 220E 4304715205 5670 Federal O\V P
R3VIJ84(44-14B) 14 070S 230E 4304715206 5670 Federal GAV P
R'ADD9(43-23B) 23 070S 230E 4304715140 5670 Federal OiW P
R'ARJ90(43-21B) 21 070S 230E 4304715211 5670 Federal OiV P
R3VIJ92 (ll-23B) 23 070S 230E 4304715212 5670 Federal O\V TA
R'A1194(12-22A) 22 070S 220E 4304715213 5670 Federal O\V P
RAVU99(12-22B) 22 070S 230E 4304715218 5670 Federal OAV P
RED WASH UNIT 259 16 070S 230E 4304732785 5670 State OW P
RED VVAdsHUNIT260 16 070S 230E 4304732786 5670 Sutte OAV P
FDARJ51(l2-16B) 16 070S 230E 4304715177 5670 Sutte O\V P
RNVUST 189(41-16B) 16 070S 230E 4304715292 5670 Sutte OYV P

REDVVASH UNIT261 17 070S 230E 4304732739 5670 Federal VVI A
FØhij 100-A(43-21A,) 21 070S 220E 4304715219 5670 Federal Y/I A
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I (N4235) to QEP (N2460) RED WASH UNIT

well_name Sec T R api Entity trase Type type stat

R3VU 102 (41-24A) 24 070S 220E 4304715221 5670 Federal YVI A
RAVU 11 27 070S 230E 4304715142 5670 Federal YVI A
R'NU 11-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733552 5670 Federal YVI A
RVVU 11-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733553 5670 Federal VVI A
RVVU ll-25A 25 070S 220E 4304733574 5670 Federed YVI A
RYVU ll-29B 29 070S 230E 4304733590 5670 Federed M'I A
RYVU 11-30B 30 070S 230E 4304733785 5670 Federal YVI A
RTVU12-24A 24 070S 220E 4304733591 5670 Federal Yll A
R3VU 13-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733497 5670 Federal VVI A
RYVU 13-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733498 5670 Federed \VI A
RTVU 13-25A 25 070S 220E 4304733575 5670 Federal YVI A
RTVU 14(14-13B) 13 070S 230E 4304715144 5670 Federed VVI A
RTVU 148(13-22B) 22 070S 230E 4304715261 5670 Federal VVI A
RgrU 150(31-22B) 22 070S 230E 4304715263 5670 Federal VVI I
RTVU156(23-15B) 15 ,070S 230E 4304715267 5670 Federed YVI A
RNVU16(43-28B) 28 (070S 230E 4304716475 5670 Federed VII I
RYVU 161(14-20B) 20 070S 230E 4304715271 5670 Federal VVI I
RYVU 17(41-20B) 20 070S 230E 4304715146 5670 Federal VVI A
IRNVUl70(4l-15B) 15 070S 230E 4304716495 5670 Federal VVI I
RTVU173 (21-21B) 21 070S 230E 4304716496 5670 Federal VVI A
RYVU 174(21-20B) 20 070S 230E 4304715281 5670 Federal M'I A
R'ARJ 182(14-21B) 21 070S 230E 4304716497 5670 Federed VVI A
RVVU183(33-13B) 13 070S 230E 4304715289 5670 Federal VVI A
P3VU185 (41-1B) 14 070S 230E 4304716498 5670 Federal YVI A
RTVU 199(43-22A) 22 070S 220E 4304715301 5670 Federed VVI A
R'ARJ2(14-24B) 24 070S 230E 4304716472 5670 Federal VVI A
RNVU202(21-34A) 34 070S 220E 4304715303 5670 Federal VVI I
RVVU2l3 (4l-33B) 33 070S 230E 4304720060 5670 Federal MnD A
RYVU2l5 (43-28A) 28 070S 220E 4304730058 5670 Fedeñd YVI A
RVVU216(21-27A) 27 070S 220E 4304730103 5670 Fedend VII A
REVU23 (21-23B) 23 070S 230E 4304715151 5670 Fedeñd YVI A
RVVl] 23-18C (97) 18 070S 240E 4304715216 5670 Federal VVI I
RSVU25(23-23B) 23 070S 230E 4304716476 5670Federal VVI A
RTVU258 (34-22A) 22 070S 220E 4304730458 5670 Federal VVI A
FØVU263(24-26B) 26 070S 230E 4304730518 5670 Federal NVI I
RVVU264(31-35B) 35 070S 230E 4304730519 5670 Federed VII A
FDARJ266(33-26B) 26 070S 230E 4304730521 5670 Federal 9/I I
RVVU268(43-17B) 17 070S 230E 4304732980 5670 Federal VVI A
RTVU269(l3-26B) 26 070S 230E 4304730522 5670 Fedend VVI I
FØWU27l(42-35B) 35 070S 230E 4304731081 5670 Fedend YVI I
RNVU275(31-26B) 26 070S 230E 4304731077 5670 Federal Y/I A
RTVU279(ll-36B) 36 070S 230E 4304731052 5670 Federed YVI A
FØVU283(43-l8B) 18 070S 230E 4304732982 5670Federal VVI A
ff64] 31-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733555 5670 Federal VVl A
RYVU31-25A 25 070S 220E 4304733577 5670 Federed NVI A
FDARJ3l-30B 30 070S 230E 4304733788 5670 Fedeñd VVI A
R'ARJ33-l9B 19 070S 230E 4304733499 5670 Federal VVI A
R'ARJ33-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733500 5670 Federal YVI A
RTVU33-25A 25 070S 220E 4304733578 5670 Federal VII A
finSJ 33-30B 30 070S 230E 4304733790 5670 Federal VVI A
FØVIJ34(23-14B) 14 070S 230E 4304715161 5670 Federal VII A
IUMTU34-13A 13 070S 220E 4304733593 5670 Federal VVI A
RNVU34-24A 24 070S 220E 4304733568 5670 Federal YVI A
RTVU48 (32-19B) 19 070S 230E 4304715174 5670 Federed YVI I
RTVU56(4l-28B) 28 070S 230E 4304715182 5670 Fedenal Y/I A
R'A1] 59 (12-24B) 24 070S 230E 4304716477 5670 Fedend YVI A
Finnl6(41-21B) 21 070S 230E 4304716482 5670 Federed YVI A
RNVU61(12-27A) 27 070S 220E 4304716478 5670 Federed VVI I
FDARJ68(41-13B) 13 070S 230E 4304716485 5670 Fedend YVI I
R3VIJ7(4l-27B) 27 070S 230E 4304716473 5670 Federal VVI I
RTVU88 (23-18B) 18 070S 230E 4304715210 5670 Federal YVI A
R'ARJ9l (33-22B) 22 070S 230E 4304716479 5670 Fedenal VVI A
finnl93 (43-27B) 27 070S 230E 4304716480 5670 Federal vil I
RTVU324(23-16B) 16 070S 230E 4304733084 5670 State VVI I
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United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

ACH a Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
UT-922

June 9, 2003

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
1050 17th Street, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265

Re: Red Wash Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

On May 30, 2003, we received an indenture dated February 1, 2003, whereby Shenandoah Energy,
Inc. changed it name and QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. was designated as Successor UnitOperator for the
Red Wash Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effectiveJune 9, 2003.
In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the
designated party has obtained all required approval that would entitle it to conduct operations under
Red Wash Unit Agreement.

Your nationwide (Eastern States) oil and gas bond No. BOOOO24willbe used to cover all operations
within the Red Wash Unit.

It is requested that you notify all interested parties of the name change of unit operator. Copies of
the approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriate federal offices, with one copy
returned herewith.

Sincerely,

/s/ Robert A. Henricks

Robert A. Henricks
Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure
bcc: Field Manager - Vernal (wlenclosure)

SITLA
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
Minerals Adjudication Group
File - Red Wash Unit (wlenclosure)
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron
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JUL 0 Y2003
3104 (932.34)WF
Nationwide Bond ESB000024

NOTICE

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. : Oil and Gas
1050 17* Street Suite 500 : lease
Denver, Colorado 80265 :

Name Change Recognized

Acceptable evidence has been filed in this office concerning the name change of Shenandoah
Energy Incorporated into QEP Uinta Basin, Incorporated. QEP Uinta Basin, Incorporated is the
surviving entity. This name change is recognized effective April 17, 2003.

Eastern States will notify the Minerals Management Service and all applicable Bureau of Land
Management offices of the change by a copy of this notice.

If you identify other leases in which the merging entity maintain an interest, please contact this
office and we will appropriately document those files with a copy of this notice.

If you have any questions, please contact Bill Forbes at 703-440-1536.

Wilbert B. Forbes
Land Law Examiner

Branch of Use Authorization
Division of Resources Planning,

Use and Protection

bc: JFO,MMS, ES RF, 930 RF, 932.34 RF, E-932: wbf:07 /07/03:440-1536/ QEP Unita



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET
2. CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 1/1/2007

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2460-QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. N5085-QuestarE&P Company

1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265

Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900 Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900

CA No. Unit: RED WASH UNIT

WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

SEE ATTACHED LISTS *

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentationwas received from the FORMER operator on: 4/19/2007

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 4/16/2007
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 1/31/2005
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143

5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: n/a

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 4/23/2007 BIA
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 4/23/2007
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on:
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on:
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 799446
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965003033
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS: THIS IS A COMPANY NAME CHANGE.
SOME WELL NAMES HAVE BEEN CHANGED AS REQUESTED

Questar E&P FORM A.xls 4/30/2007 AND



1 of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Wel1Name QIQ SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RWU l (41-26B) RW 41-26B 'NENE 26 070S 230E 4304715135 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 3 (34-23B) RW 34-23B SWSE 23 070S 230E 4304715136 5670 Federal OW P
RWU4(41-22B) RW41-22B |NENE 22 070S 230E 4304715137 5670 'Federal OW TA
RWU 5 (41-23B) RW 41-23B 'NENE 23 070S 230E 4304715138 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 8 (32-22B) RW 32-22B SWNE 22 070S 230E 4304715139 5670 Federal OW P
RTVLI9 (43-23B) livV43-23B FUESE 23 070S 230E 4304715140 5670 Federal O3AT P
RWU 10 (12-23B) RW 12-23B iSWNW 23 070S 230E 4304715141 5670 Federal OW TA
RNVU11 FCA'34-27B SVVSE 27 070S 230E 4304715142 99996 Federal VVI A
RWU 13 (14-22B) RW 14-22B SWSW 22 070S 230E 4304715143 5670 Federal OW TA
FCgr14-13B RYVl4-13B STVSTV 13 070S 230E 4304715144 99995 Federal YVI A
FDASJ15 (32-17C) FON32-17C STVNE 17 070S 240E

,
4304715145 5670 Fedenal CTWT P

RWU 17 (41-20B) RW 41-20B NENË 20 070S 230E 43047]5146 5670 Federal WI_ _ A
R3RTJl9 (34-.26B) 100/34-26B STVSE 26 070S 230E i 4304715148 5670 Federal GP¥ S
FONIJ21 (32-14B) ICA'32-14B S3ATTE 14 1070S 230E 4304715250 , 5670 Fedend OVV P
RWU23 (21-23B) RW 21-23B SENW 23 070S 230E 43_04715151 | 99996 Federal IWI A
RYVU24(34-14B) IUn'34-14B SNVSE 14 070S 230E 4304715152 5670 Federal ONV S
RWU 26 (23-22B) RW 23-22B NESW 22 070S 230E 4304715153 5670 Federal OW TA
RTVII27(43-14B) ECWf43-14B NESE 14 070S 230E 4304715154 5670 Fedend (TW' TTA
RM/U28 (43-22B) R3¥43-22B NESE 22 070S i 230E 4304715155 5670 Fedend ()?V P
RWU 29 (32-23B) RW 32-23B SWNE 23 070S 230E 4304715156 5670 Federal OW P
FCAT23-13B ICB123-13B FEESTV - 13 070S 230E 4304715157 5670 Fedeñd (iW1 T,4
FDARJ31 (34-22B) FUN34-22B STVSE 22 ' 070S 230E 4304715158 5670 Fedeñal OXV P
RWU 33 (14-14B) RW 14-14B SWSW 14 ) 070S 230E 4304715160 5670 Federal GW TA
R\VU34(23-14B) Ifn'23-14B FRESVV 14 |070S 230E 4304715161 99996 Federal 3¥I A
RW 43-13B RW 43-13B NESE 13 0708 230E 4304715162 5670 Federal OW TA
FERTO36(32-13B) R3¥32-13B SivliE 13 ! 070S 230E 4304715163 5670 Federal (39V P
RWU 38 (14-23B) RW 14-23B SWSW 23 0708 230E 4304715165 5670 Federal OW |P
RWU 39 (14-24A) RW 14-24A SWSW 24 070S 220E 4304715166 5670 Federal OW |TA
RWU40 (21-24B) RW 21-24B NENW 24 070S 230E 4304715167 5670 Federal OW TA
RSVU41 (34-13B) IUM/34-13B SVVSE 13 070S 230E 4304715168 5670 Fixieral ONV P
RWU42 (21-29C) RW 21-29C NENW 29 0708 240E 4304715169 5670 Federal GW P
R3VIJ43 (12-17B) R\V 12-17B SYVNIV 17 070S 230E ! 4304715170 5670 Fedend Cny P
RWU44 (32-33C) RW 32-33C SWNE 33 070S 240E : 4304715171 5670 Federal GW P
RWU45(23-30B) RW23-30B NESW 30 070S 230E 4304715172 5670 Federal OW TA
RTVU46(41-21C) Ifwf41-21C NENE 21 070S 240E 4304715173 5670 Fedend GAW 134
RYVU48(32-19B) ICA'32-19B SYVFUE 19 070S 230E 4304715174 99996 IFederd TVI I
RWU 49 (12-29B) RW 12-29B SWNW 29 070S 230E 4304715175 5670 Federal ,OW TA
RWU 50 (14-23A) RW 14-23A SWSW 23 070S 220E i 4304715176 5670 Federal OW -P
RWU 52 (14-18B) RW 14-18B SWSW 18 070S 230E | 4304715178 5670 Federal OW TA
RNVU53(41-25A) IEW'41-25A FRENE 25 070S 220E 4304715179 5670 Federal ONV TA
RTVII56(41-28B) Irgr41-28B EfiNE 28 070S 230E 4304715182 99996 Fedeml 5¥I



2 of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N24 30) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RE 3 WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RWU 57 (12-18C) RW 12-18C SWNW 18 070S 240E 4304715183 : 5670 Federal :OW P
RWU 63 (21-22B) IRW 21-22B NENW 22 070S 230E 4304715186 i 5670 Federal GW TA
RWU 64 (32-27B) RW 32-27B SWNE 27 070S 230E

43047¯5187
5670 Federal OW TA

RNVII66(34-18B) RMT34-18B STVSE 18 070S 230E 4304715189 5670 Ëederal OTV P
RWU 67 (42-22B) iRW 42-22B _ _ SENE 22 070S 230E 4304715190 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 69 (21-27B) RW 21-27B NENW 27 070S 230E 4304715191 : 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 70 (23-22A) _ 'RW 23-22A NESW 22 070S 220E 4304715192 5670 Federal OW P
FONU71 (21-18C) PON21-18C NGENNV 18 070S 240E 4304715193 5670 Federal OYV P
RWU 72 (23-27B) |RW 23-27B NESW 27 070S | 230E 4304715194 5670 Federal IOW TA
RWU 74 (12-13B) IRW 12-13B SWNW 13 070S 230E 4304715196 5670 Federal GW S
RWU 75 (21-26B) iRW 21-26B NENW 26 070S 230E 4304715197 5670 Federal OW TA
RAVU76(32-18C) RM/32-18C STV>UI 18 |070S .240E 4304715198 567ÒFederal G\V P
RWU 77 (21-13B) RWU 77 (21-13B) NENW 13 ' 070S 230E 4304715199 5670 Federal OW P
FCA1378 (32-28B) RTV32-28B SNVIDE 28 070S 230E 4304715200 5670 Fedend CON P
RAVIJ79(12-27B) RAV12-27B SvibnW 27 070S 230E 4304715201 5670 Federd CON TA
R3N1180 (14-278) RV/ 14-27B SVVS3V 27 070S i 230E 4304715202 5670 Fedend CON S
RTVLí8l (41-31B) P3N41-31B FEEbni 31 070S . 230E 4304715203 5670 Federal CAN P
FDASJ83 (41-27A) RYV41-27A NEFUE 27 070S 220E 4304715205 5670 Federal CON P
R3NIJS4(44-14B)_ COT44-14B SESE 14 070S 230E 4304715206 5670 Fedeñd GRY P
R3¥\J88 (23-18B) RTV23-18B __ NESTV _ 18 i 070S 230E 4304715210 5670 Fedend TVI at
RNVU90(43-21B) RV/43-21B NESE 21 070S 230E 4304715211 5670 Federed 03¥ P
RWU92 (ll-23B) RW ll-23B NWNW 23 i 070S 230E 4304715212 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 94 (l2-22A) RW 12-22A SWNW 22 070S 220E 4304715213 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 23-18C (97) RW 23-18C NESW 18 070S 240E , 4304715216 99996 Federal WI I
RYYLI99(12-22B) Irvi 12-22B STVliv/ 22 0708 230E 4304715218 5670 Federal (39V IP
RWlJ 100-A (43-21A) RW 43-21A NESE 21 070S 220E 4304715219 5670 Federal iWI A
RWU 101 (34-21B) ,RW 34-21B SWSE 21 070S 230E | 4304715220 5670 Federal OW P
R3NIJ102 (41-24/k) 'R3N41-24A SETJE 24 070S 220E | 4304715221 5670 Federal .9VI A
B3N11103(34-15B) RMT34-15B STVSE 15 0708 230E 4304715222 5670 Fedenal |OVV P
P:41] 108(32-21B) GRTV32-21B SVVfDE 21 0708 230E - 4304715226 5670 Federal 139V P
R ÑU 109 (21-28B) RTV21-28B NElNYV \ 28 070S 230E 4304715227 5670 Fedenal CON P
RWU 110 (23-23A) RW 23-23A NESW 23 070S 220E 4304715228 : 5670 Federal OW P
R3¥U 111 (32-24A.) ICW'32-24A STVPRE , 24 070S 220E 4304715229 5670 Fedend 03¥ S
RWU 112 (32-28A) RW 32-28A SWNE 28 070S 220E 4304715230 5670 Federal OW S
BONIJ115(21-19B) RW121-19B FU]¾¾V 19 070S 230E 4304715 33 5670 Federal Cn¥ P
RWU 119 (43-29A) RW 43-29A _NESE 29 070S 220E 4304715236 5670 Federal OW |P
RWU 120 (23-28B) RW 23-28B NESW 28 070S 230E 4304715237 5670 Federal OW TA
RW 13-13B RW 13-13B NWSW 13 070S 230E 4304715238 5670 Federal GW P
R\VUl22(24-14B) RV/24-14B SESVV 14 070S 230E 4304715239 5670 Feden] CÃŸ :P
RMRJ125(34-19B) Ifn134-19B SNVSE 19 070S 230E 4304715242 5670 'Federid OAN T,4
RWU 126 (41-29A) RW 41-29A |NENE 29 ; 070S 220E 4304715243 5670 Federal iOW



3 of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RWU 127 (12-19B) RW 12-19B SWNW 19 | 070S 230E 4304715244 5670 Federal OW S
RYVLI129 (14-15B) RM/ 14-15B SNVSNV 15 070S 230E 4304715246 5670 Federal ()VV P
RYVU133 (41-348) RTV41-34B 74EPJE 34 070S 230E 4304715250 5670 Federal ()VV pP
RWU 136 (43-19B) RW 43-198 NESE 19 070S 230E 4304715252 5670 FederaÏ|OW TA
RWU 137 (34-28B} RW 34-28B SWSE 28 070S 230E 4304715253 5670 Federal GW TA
RWU 138 (4 l-30B) RW 41-30B NENE O 070S 230E 4304715254 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 140 (24-22B) _ _ RW 24-22B SESW 22 070S 230E 4304715255 5670 Federal OW P
ICRUJ 141(11-27B) RAV11-27B ffwavyV 27 070S 230E 4304715256 | 5670 .Fedeml ,ONV 114
RWU 143 (33-14B) RW 33-14B NWSE 14 070S 230E 4304715257 5670 IFederal OW P
RWU 144 (21-18B) RW 21-18B NENW 18 070S 230E 4304715258 5670 Federal OW TA
ICA'24-13B RV/24-13B SESTV 13 0705 230E 4304715259 5670 Fedenal CB¥ 134
B3A1J147(22-22B) FUN22-22B SE245V 22 070S 230E 4304715260 5670 Federal Ovv 134
RWU 148 (13-22B) RW 13-22B NWSW 22 070S 230E I 4304715261 99996 Federal W1 A
FDASJ150(31-22B) Ifn131-22B FPAffE 22 070S 230E 4304715263 99996 Fedend VVI I
RWU 151 (42-14B) RW 42-14B _ SENE 14 | 070S 230E 4304715264 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 153 (14-29B) RW 14-29B SWSW 29 070S 230E 4304715265 5670 Federal OW IP
FEROJ156(23-15B) I gr23-15B

FEB¯MT
15 070S 230E 4304715267 99990 Fedend $W1 A

Ri¥U 158 (32-30B) RYl32-30B STVITE 30 . 070S 230E 4304715268 5670 Federal 139V P
FDA1]160(32-15B) Ifn'32-15B _ SVV>UE 15 070S 230E 4304715270 5670 Federal CON P
RWU 161 (14-20B) RW 14-20B SWSW 20 070S 230E 4304715271 99996 Federal , WI I
RANU 162(12-20B) __ RTV 12-20B STYT4Y/ 20 070S 230E 4304715272 5670 Federal ()?V P
RWU 164 (12-28B) RW 12-28B SWNW 28 070S 230E 4304715274 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 165 (32-26B) RW 32-26B SWNE 26 070S 230E 4304715275 5670 Federal GW TA
RWU 167 (23-21B) RW 23-21B NESW 21 0708 230E 4304715277 : 5670 Federal OW S
RWU 168 (23-24B) RW 23-24B ,NESW 24 070S 230E 4304715278 i 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 172 (21-30B) RW 21-30B NENW 30 0708 230E I 4304715280 : 5670 Federal OW TA
RIARJ174(21-20B) FØV21-20B EniblA' 20 0708 230E 4304715281 | 5670 Federal Y/I ik
FDA11176(31-28B) ICA'31-28B PPATVE 28 070S 230E i 4304715283 5670 Fedend CON 134
RWU 177 (42-28B) RW 42-28B SENE 28 070S 230E 4304715284 5670 Federal OW TA
IUn/22-13B Ifn/22-13B SElin' 13 070S 230E 4304715285 5670 Fedend ONV 354
RWU 180 (31-23B) _ _ RW 31-23B NWNE 23 070S 230E 4304715287 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 181 (34-30B) RW 34-30B SWSE 30 070S 230E 4304715288 5670 Federal OW P
IUn'33-13B RVV33-13B NRWSE 13 070S .230E 4304715289 5670 Fedeñd TVI A
RWU 184 (23-26B) [RW 23-26B NESW 26 070S I 230E 4304715290 5670 Federal GW S
RWU 188 (23-20B) RW 23-20B NESW , 20 . 070S 230E 4304715291 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 192 (41-33A) RW 41-33A NENE i 33 070S 220E 4304715294 5670 Federal OW P
R343] 193 (43-24B) EUR/43-24B NESE 24 070S 230E 4304715295

¯
5670 Federal CPN 134

RNVU194(12-14B) RTV12-14B SYVANY 14 070S 230E 4304715296 5670 Federal COW S
RYVLI196(23-17C) RAW23-17C FEESTV 17 070S 240E 4304715298 5670 Federal GRAT TAL

RWU 199 (43-22A) RW 43-22A NESE 22 070S 220E 4304715301 99996 Federal WI A
RWU 201 (32-28C) RW 32-28C iSWNE 28 070S 240E 4304715302 5670 Federal GW



4 of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RTVU202(21-34A) IUw/21-34A NENTV 34 0708 220E 4304715303 99996 Fedem] VVI I
Ifül]204(23-25As) BON23-25As NESTV 25 070S 220E 4304715305 5670 Fedend CON P
F3ARJ205(23-21C) FON23-21C NESNV 21 070S 240E 4304715306 5670 Fedenal CON TA
IUMTU2(144b‡B) RNV144L4B STVSNV 24 070S 230E 4304716472 99996 Fedend VVI A
RWU 7 (41-27B) RW 41-27B |NENE 27 070S 230E 4304716473 99996 Federal |WI I
RWR43-28B) RW 43-28B \NESE 28 070S 230E 4304716475 99996 Federal WI I
RWU 25 (23-23B) RW 23-23B NESW 23 070S 230E 4304716476 99996 Federal WI A
RWU 59 (12-24B) RW 12-24B SWNW 24 070S 230E 4304716477 99996 Federal WI A
RWU 61 (12-27A) RW 12-27A SWNW 27 070S 220E | 4304716478 99996 Federal .WI _ I
RWU 91 (33-22B) RW 33-22B INWSE 22 070S 230E 4304716479 99996 Federal WI A
RWU 93 (43-27B) RW 43-27B INESE 27 070S 230E 4304716480 99996 Federal WI I
RWU 6 (41-21B) RW 41-21B INENE 21 070S 230E I 4304716482 99996 Federal WI A
RTVII68 (41-13B) gr41-13B JfEFU: 13 070S 230E 4304716485 99996 Federal YVI I
RWU 170 (41-15B) RW 41-15B NENE 15 070S 230E . 4304716495 99996 Federal WI I
RWU 173 (21-21B) RW 21-21B NENW 21 070S 230E 4304716496 99996 Federal WI A
RWU 182 (14-21B) RW 14-21B SWSW 21 070S I 230E 4304716497 99996 Federal WI A
FDARJ185(41-lB) Rw/41-14B NHilfE 14 070S i230E i 4304716498 99996 Fedend Vil A
RTV11212(41-8F) ECn'41-8F NG:NE 08 080S '240E 4304720014 5670 Fedentl GM' P
RWU 213 (41-33B) RW 41-33B NENE 33 070S 230E 4304720060 99996 Federal WD A
RWU 215 (43-28A) RW 43-28A NESE _28 | 070S 220E 4304730058 99996 Federal WD A
RNVU216(21-27A) _ IEW21-27A PLEbnV 27 070S 220E 4304730103 99996 Fedeñd YVI A
RWU 219 (44-21C) RW 44-21C SESE 21 070S 240E 4304730 149 5670 Federal GW S
EUMTU220(22-23B) R3A'22-23B SEf4vl 23 070S 230E 4304730192 5670 Fedend ()?V T,4
RWU 221 (13-27B) RW 13-27B NWSW 27 070S 230E 4304730199 5670 Federal OW TA
RYTU222(31-27B) R3A'31-27B FTYl>pi 27 0708 230E 4304730200 5670 Federal :(39V TA
RWU 224 (44-22B) RW 44-22B SESE 22 070S 230E 4304730202 5670 Federal IGW TA
B¾All225 (13-23E() FCA/13-23B f VISTV 23 070S 230E 4304730212 5670 Federal (39V TIL
RWU 226 (24-23B) RW 24-23B SESW 23 0705 230E 4304730249 5670 Federal i GW S
RWU 227 (14-26B) RW 14-26B SWSW 26 0708 230E 4304730257 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 228 (21-34B) RW 21-34B NENW 34 0708 230E 4304730258 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 229 (43-26B) RW 43-26B NESE 26 070S 230E 4304730259 5670 Federal OW TA
R3411230(l4-18C) Rvi 14-18C SVVSVV 18 070S 240E 4304730309 5670 Federal O'N P
RWU 231 (21-35B) RW 21-35B NENW 35 070S 230E 4304730310 ' 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 232 (12-26B) RW 12-26B _ _ .SWNW 26 070S 230E 4304730311 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 233 (12-25B) RW 12-25B SWNW 25 070S 230E : 4304730312 i 5670 Federal OW TA
RNVU234(32-24B) R'n'32-24B SYVÏË 24 070S 230E

,
4304730313 5670 Fedend CON P

RWU 235 (34-18C) RW 34-18C .SWSE 18 070S 240E 4304730314 5670 Federal OW S
RTVU236(21-19C) RAN21-19C 14ElfM/ 19 070S 240E 4304730340 5670 Feden11 GON P
R3VU237(14-25B) RNV14-25B SNVSTV 25 070S 230E 4304730341 5670 Fedend ONV P
RTVLI238 (32-35B) R3¥32-35B 89VT(E_ 35 070S 230E 4304730342 5670 Federal ()?V Tit
RWU 239 (41-35B) RW 41-35B NENE 35 0708 230E 4304730343 5670 Federal OW



5 of 7 QEP UintaBasin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
REDWASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

80A'IU240(12-36B)
___

FUN12-36B STVITY/ 36 070S 230E 4304730344 5670 Federal O'N S
EDNIJ241(22-14B) RM/22-14B SEFUN 14 0708 230E 4304730345 5670 Federal OYV P
Ein'42-13B f gr42-13B SEffE 13 070S 230E 4304730346 5670 Fedend ONV P
RIVIJ243 (42-18C) fin/42-18C SEffE 18 0705 240E 4304730347 5670

Fede¯l
COW TA

BDA1J244(23-19C) PD¥23-19C NESTV 19 0708 240E 4304730348 5670 Ipderal GRW P
90ARJ246(22-18C) RNV22-18C_ SElfvl 18 0708 240E 4304730387 5670 Federal ETür P
RIVIJ247(22-17C) RM/22-17C SElfv/ 17 0708 240E 4304730388 5670 Fedenil GAV P
RWU 258 (34-22A) RW 34-22A SWSE 22 0708 220E 4304730458 567ÖFederal WI A
RWU 262 (22-26B) RW 22-26B SENW 26 0708 230E 4304730517 5670 Federal GW ITA
RWU 263 (24-26B) RW 24-26B SESW 26 070S 230E I 4304730518 99996 Federal WI I
RTVU264(31-35B) Ituf31-35B 1(VTNE 35 070S 230E 4304730519 99996 Federal NVI A
RWU 265 (44-26B)

¯
RW 44-26B SESE 26 070S 230E 4304730520 5670 Federal GW P

RWU 266 (33-26B) RW 33-26B .NWSE 26 070S 230E 4304730521 I_9999_6 Federal WI |I
RWU 269 (13-26B) RW 13-26B INWSW 26 070S 230E 4304730522 99996 Federal WI A
RWU273(42-27B) RW42-27B SENE 27 070S 230E 4304731051 5670 Federal OW _TA
RWU 279 (11-36B) RW ll-36B NWNW 36 .

070S . 230E 4304731052 99996 Federal WI A
RWU 276 (44-27B) RW 44-27B SESE 27 | 070S I 230E 4304731053 5670 Federal OW TA
FUNU272(44-23B) RTV44-23B SESE 23 070S 230E 4304731054 5670 Federed GSV P
RNVU278(11-26) RTVll-26 FDAlfy/ 26 070S4_230E 4304731076 5670 Federed Giv TA
RWU 275 (31-26B) RW 31-26B NWNE 26 070S 230E 4304731077 99996 Federal WI A
RWU 280 (ll-35B) RW 11-35B NWNW 35 070S 230E 4304731079 5670 Federal OW

¯

RWU 282 (42-26B) RW 42-26B SENE 26 070S 230E 4304731080 5670 Federal GW TA
RY/U271 (42-35B) R3W42-35B SERVE 35 0708 | 230E 4304731081 5670 Federal VVI I
R3A3J270(22-35B) RTV22-35B SEfivV 35 0708 230E 4304731082 | 5670 Federal ()TV P
RWU284(33-23B) IRW33-23B NWSE i23 0708 230E,4304731476.5670Federal IGW TA
RWU 285 (11-24B) RW ll-24B NWNW I 24 0708 230E I 4304731477 5670 Federal OW P
RETU286(42-21B) (R3N42-21B SETTE I 21 0708 230E 4304731478 '

5670 Federal (39V JP
R3N44-13B R3W44-13B SESE 13 070S 230E 4304731512 5670 Federal ()?V Tik
RWU 288 (24-27) RW 24-27 .SESW 27 070S 230E 4304731513 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 289 (13-24B) RW 13-24B NWSW 24 070S 230E 4304731517 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 292 (42-23B) RW 42-23B SENE 23 070S 230E 4304731576 5670 Federal GW TA
RWU 295 (11-22B) RW 11-22B NWNW 22 070S 230E 4304731577 5670 Federal GW TA
RTVU296(12-35B) RSV12-35B STV>SV 35 1070S 1230E 4304731578 5670 Federal CTW7 S
RWU 297 (24-15B) RW 24-15B SESW 15 070S 230E 4304731579 5670 iFederal OW P
RWU 293 (22-22A) RW 22-22A SENW 22 070S 220E 4304731581 5670 Federal OW TA
P3WU294(24-18C) RV/24-18C SESTV 18 ,070S 240E 4304731582 5670 Federal GNV P
RWU 298 (22-27B) RW 22-27B SENW 27 070S 230E 4304731679 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 301 (43-15B) RW 43-15B NESE 15 0708 230E 4304731682 5670 Federal GW TA
RWU 302 (22-24B) RW 22-24B SENW 24 0708 230E 4304731683 5670 Federal GW TA
RM11303(34-17B) RM/34-17B SVVSE I 17 0708 230E 4304731819 5670 Federal OVV P
RED WASH 305 (41-4F) RW 41-4F C-NE 04 080S 240E 4304732538 | 5670 Federal GW



6 of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RED \VrtSEl306 ICR/23-23C 14ESTV 23 070S 240E 4304732629 5670 Federal Cygr p
RTVII207 RYVl4-17B STVSTV 17 0708 230E 4304732738 5670 Federal Cygr p
RED WASH UNIT 261 RW 23-17B NESW 17 0708 230E 4304732739 5670 Federal WI A
ECurU268 (4i-Ï7E6 R3W43-17B _ FEBSE 17 0708 230E 4304732980 5670 Federal VVI A
RTVIJ267(32-17B) IEgr32-17B SvibHi 17 0708 230E 4304732981 5670 Federed Cygr y
RYVLI283(43-18B) RAN43-18B NESE 18 0708 230E 4304732982 5670 Federal VVI A
RYVU299(32-18B) fin'32-18B 89V>UE 18 0708 230E 4304733018 5670 Federal IONV P
RWU 42-20B RW 42-20B SENE 20 070S 230E 4304733490 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 22-20B RW 22-20B SENW 20 070S 230E 4304733491 5670 Federal OW S
RSVU24-19B Ein'24-19B SESJV 19 070S 230E 4304733492 5670 Federal iONV P
R3NIJl3-19B RNVl3-19B NWVSVV 19 070S 230E 4304733497 , 5670 FederEd NVI Á
RWU 13-20B _ RW 13-20B NWSW 20 070S 230E 4304733498 5670 Federal WI A
RW1133-19B RM'33-19B FAVSE 19 .070S 230E 4304733499 5670 Federed VVI A
EUMTU33-20B R'Ar33-20B fŒYVSE 20 070S 230E 4304733500 5670 Federal VI A
RED WASH 22-21B RW 22-21B SENW 21 070S 230E 4304733522 5670 Federal OW S
RED WASH 24-20B IRW 24-20B SESW 20 070S 230E 4304733523 5670 Federal OW P
RED n'ASH44-19B iltn'44-19B SESE 19 070S 230E 4304733524 5670 Fedend Cfni P
RED WASH 44-20B RW 44-20B SESE 20 070S 230E 4304733525 5670 Federal OW P
R N1111-19B RTV11-19B NVŒNNV 19 070S 230E 4304733552 5670 Fedend TVI A
FDA3]11-20B R'N 11-20B NIV7IV/ 20 0708 230E 4304733553 5670 Federal TVI A
RTVII24-18B ECW'24-18B SESTV 18 070S 230E 4304733554 5670 Federal CON P
RW 31-19B RW 31-19B NWNE 19 070S 230E 4304733555

¯Š¯76
Federal IWI A

RWU 42-19B RW 42-19B SENE 19 070S 230E 4304733556 . 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 22-19B RW 22-19B SENW 19 070S 230E 4304733559 5670 [Federal OW iP
RWU 23-24A RW 23-24A NESW | 24 070S 220E 4304733567 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 34-24A RW 34-24A SWSE 24 070S 220E 4304733568 5670 Federal WI A
RWU 42-24A RW 42-24A SENE 24 070S 220E 4304733569 5670 Federal OW S
R3¥\J 11-25/s RYVll-25/L bnA14NV 25 070S 220E 4304733574 5670 Federal VVI A
R3431 13-25/k RVI 13-25/t __ fiY/STV 25 070S 220E 4304733575 5670 Federal VVI A
RTVIJ21-25A Itur21-25A NENYV . 25 070S 220E 4304733576 5670 Fedend O1AT P
RTVII31-25A ffü'31-25A FDATIE 25 070S |220E 4304733577 5670 Fedend VVI A
R3WIJ33-25/s RYl33-25/L fiv/SE 25 070S 220E 4304733578 5670 Federal 1¥I A
y gr41-25AJ< RS/41-25A ILENHi 25 070S 220E 4304733579 5670 ÈedeñdCON P
ffMTU42-25/t RTVLI42-25/t SEbni 25 0708 220E 4304733580 5670 Federal ()97 Trk
RWU ll-29B RW ll-29B NWNW 29 0708 230E 4304733590 5670 Federal WI A
FDASJ12-24)t llTV 12-24/6 S\¾749V 24 070S 220E 4304733591 5670 Federal 9/1 A
RWU 21-24A RW 21-24A NENW 24 070S 220E 43047335 2 5670 Federal OW P
RSVU34-13A RM/34-13A STVSE 13 070S 220E 4304733593 5670 Federal TVI A
EUMTU44-18B RIN44-18B SESE 18 070S .230E 4304733594 5670 Federal ()VV P
ITET22-13/t fin/22-13A SETTwi 13 070S .220E 4304733765 13296 Fedend ¡ONV S
RTTLT22-29Il FON22-29B SE199V i 29 i 070S | 230E 4304733766 5670 Federal ()?V



7 of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RV/U41-24A R3Y41-24/t IEEbnE 24 070S 220E 4304733769 5670 Federal CAW P
RWU42-30B RW42-30B SENE | 30 070S 230E 4304733771 5670 Federal OW P
FUMTU44-30B R342J44-30B SESE 30 070S 230E 4304733772 5670 Federal ()VV P
RTVUll-30B RYVll-30B FAV>DN: 30 070S 230E 4304733785 5670 Federal TVI A
RTVU22-25As Fi'N22-25/t SEff9/ i 25 070S 220E 4304733786 5670 Fedent] CON P
RYTET31-30B __ FCAT31-30B NBA24E [ 30 070S 230E 4304733788 5670 Fedend TVI A
POWIJ33-30Il FUN33-30B NONSE : 30 070S 230E 4304733790 5670 Fedend TVI At
RED WASH U 34-27C RW 34-27C SWSE 27 070S 240E 4304735045 5670 Federal GW P
FDASJ34-22C Itur34-22C STVSE 22 ; 070S 240E 4304735098 5670 Federd GNV P
F 12Gi-20C RNV12G-20C SNV>SV 20 | 070S 240E 4304735239 14011 Federal GD¥ S
RM/43G-08F RMT43Gi-08F NESE 08 080S 240E .4304735655 Fedend GilV Ad?D
RM/22Gi-09F RM/22Gi-09F SEbnV 09 OSOS 240E |430473565615636 IFederal GIV OPS
RWU 34-23AG RW 34-23AG SWSE 23 070S 220E ' 4304735668 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 34-27AG RWU 34-27AD |SWSE 27 070S 220E 4304735669

' 5670 Federal OW DRL
R\N1J32-27/tGi RY/U32-27/uG SYVfdE 27 070S i220E 4304735670 : 5670 Federal CAAT S
RW 14-34AMU RW 14-34AMU SWSW 34 070S 220E Í 4304735671 i 14277 Federal GW P
RW 12-08FG RW 12-08FG SWÑW

¯
08 080S 240E 4304736348 |Federal GW APD

RTVakt-08FG RTV645-08FG SESE 08 080S 240E 4304736349 15261 Federal GNV P
RSV12-17FG RTV12-17FG SNVbnV 17 080S |240E 4304736350 Federal GDW APD
RW 34-34 AMU RW 34-34 AD SWSE I 34 070S 220E 4304736351 Federal GW APD
RW 44-35 AMU RW 44-35 AMU SESE 35 070S 220E 4304736352 Federal GW APD
RW 14-35 AMU RW 14-35 AMU SWSW 35 070S 220E 430473635 i Federal GW ÄPD
RW 33-31 BMU RW 33-31 BD NWSE 31 070S 230E 4304736357 Federal GW APD
RW 13-31 BMU RW 13-31 BD NWSW I 31 070S 230E 4304736358 Federal GW APD
RM/32-15FGi RYl32-15FGi SMOVE I 15 10803 240E 4304736443 Federal GON Ad?D
RW 21-26AG RW 21-26AD NENW 26 : 0708 220E 4304736768 Federal OW APD
RAV43-26AvG R3W43-26/cG FRESE 26 0708 220E 4304736769 Federal (TRI AUPD
RW43-23AG IRW43-23AG NESE 23 070S 220E 4304736770 I Federal OW APD
RW 41-26AG

, RW 41-26AG
_ _

NENE 26 0708 220E 4304736818 i iFederal OW APD
RW 04-25BG .RW 04-25B NWSW 25 0708 230E 4304736982 : Federal OW APD
RW 01-25BG RW 01-25BG NWNW 25 070S 230E 4304736983 Federal OW APD
RW 04-26BG RW 04-26BG SESW 26 070S 230E 4304736984 Federal OW APD
RM101-26BG RM101-26BG SYVNAV 26 070S 230E 4304736985 Federd ONV AJ'D
RW 01-35BG RW 01-35BG SWNW 35 07ÒS 230E 4304736986 Federal IOW



1 of 1 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RWU 51 (12-16B) RW 12-16B SWNW 16 070S 230E 4304715177 5670 State OW P
RWU ST 189 (41-16B) RW 41-16B NENE 16 070S 230E 4304715292 5670 State iOW S
RED WASH UNIT 259 RW 14-16B SWSW 16 070S 230E 4304732785 5670 State OW _ _ P
RED WASH UNIT 260 RW 34-16B SWSE 16 070S 230E 4304732786 5670 State OW P
RWU 324 (23-16B) RW 23-16B SESW 16 070S 230E 4304733084 5670 State WI OPS
RWU 21W-36A _ RWU 21W-36A NENW 36 070S 220E ; 4304733730 State GW LA
RWU21G-36A RWU 21G-36A NENW 36 070S 220E : 4304733731 .State OW LA
RWU 41-36A RWU 4 l-56A NENE 36 070S 220E | 4304733732 State OW LA
RWU43-16B RWU43-16B NESE 16 070S 230E 4304733733 IState OW LA
RTVLI21-16B RYVU21-16B NENIV 16 070S 230E 4304733754 State Cin' LA
RMTI 11-36A RWU 11-36A NWNW 36 070S 220E 4304733736 State OW LA
RWU 13-36A RWU 13-36A NWSW 36 070S - 220E 4304733737 State OW LA
R1N32Gi-16C RAT32G-16C SVŒ>E: , 16 070S 240E 4304735238 5670 State G\V P
RW 14-36AMU RW 14-36AMU SWSW 36 070S 220E 4304736721 State GW IAPD
RW 01-36BG RW 01-36BG NWNW 36 0708 230E 430475688 5670 State OW S
RW 24-16BG RW 24-16BG SESW 16 070S 230E 4304737746 5670 IState OW DRL
RW 12-32BG RW 12-32BG SWNW 32 070S | 230E 4304737946 15841 State GW



STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING S. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

see attached
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 IFINDIAN ALhLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do not use this form for proposals to dritinew wells,significantly deepen existing wells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells,or to
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals. See attached

1. TYPE OF WELL -- -- 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER;OIL WELL [_| GAS WELL [_j OTHER see attached
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR 9. API NUMBER.

QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANY attached
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, ORWILDCAT:
1050 17th Street Suite 500 ,. , Denver sy,,, CO ,80265 (303) 308-3068

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: attached couNTY: Ulntah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart; CASING REPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

1/1/2007 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUGBACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL slTE OTHER: Operator Narne
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Change

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show allpertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective January 1, 2007 operator of record,QEP Uinta Basin, Inc., willhereafter be known as QUESTAR EXPLORATION
AND PRODUCTION COMPANY. Thls name change involves onlyan internal corporate name change and no thirdparty
change of operator is involved. The same employeeswillcontinue to be responsible for operatlonsof theproperties described
on the attached list. AIIoperationswillcontinueto be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLMReference No. ESBOOOO24)
Utah State Bond Number: 965003033 ,

Fee Land Bond Number: 965003033
Current operatorof record, QEP UINTABASIN, IN , hereby r signs as operatorof the properties as described on the
attached list.

Ja es , Executive Vice President, QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
Successor operator of record, QUESTAR EXPLORATIO É PO UCTIONCOMPANY, hereby assumes all rights, duties
and obligations as operator of the propertles as descr ed on the ttachedlist

Jayf. Neese, Exec tiveVice President
Q6estar Explorationand Production Company

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) D rSK. Stanberry ; ) TITLE Supervisor, Regulatory Affalrs

SIGNATI.lRE DATE 3/16/2007

(This spaeo for Stato use only)

RECFVE
APR1 3 2007

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse SIde)

DN.0F0\L,GAS&



STATEOFUTAH FORMS
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GASAND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIAL.NUMBER:
see attached

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 NDAN LhLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do not use thisform for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to See attacheddrill horizontal laterals Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.
1 TYPE OF WELL 6. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER see attached
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR. 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY attached

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT
1050 17th Street Suite 500 Denver sy,,, CO 80265 (303) 308-3068

4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE 8ÍtBChed COUNTY; Ulntah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATECURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTOREPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

1/1/2007 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR
CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK O WATER DISPOSAL(Submit originalForm Only)
CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFFDate of workcompletion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMAflONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Well Name Changes
O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED ORCOMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show allpertinent details including dates, deptils, volurnes,etc.

PER THE ATTACHEDLIST OF WELLS, QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANYREQUESTS THAT THE
INDIVIDUALWELL NAMES BE UPDATED INYOUR RECORDS.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) n , TITLE Supervisor, Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATURE 4/17/2007

(This space for State use only)

RECEfVED
APR18 2007(See instructions on ReverseSide

DN.OF016GAS&MINiNG



United States Department of the Interior
BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT

Utah State Office T^KE PR DE
P.O. Box 45155 "Am emcA

Salt Lake City,UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
UT-922

April 23, 2007

Questar Exploration and Production Company
1050 17th Street, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265

Re: Red Wash Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

On April 12, 2007, we received an indenture dated April 6, 2007, whereby QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
resigned as Unit Operator and Questar Exploration and Production Company was designated as
Successor Unit Operator for the Red Wash Unit,Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effectiveApril23, 2007.
In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the

designated party has obtained all requiredapproval that wouldentitle itto conductoperations under
the Red Wash UnitAgreement.

Yournationwideoiland gas bond No. ESBOOOO24willbe used tocover allfederal operations within
the Red Wash Unit.

It is requested that you notifyall interested parties of the change in unit operator. Copies of the
approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriatefederal offices,with one copy returned
herewith.

Sincerely,

/s/ Greg J. Noble

Greg J. Noble
ActingChief, Branch of FluidMinerals

Enclosure
bcc: Field Manager - Vernal (wlenclosure)

SITLA
Division of Oil,Gas &Mining
File - Red Wash Unit(wlenclosure)
Agr. Sec. Chron ggggivED
Reading File
Central Files ggg 30 2ÛÛÎ

UT922:TAThompson:tt:4/23/07

gy OFOLGAS&



Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES OOM
10 -

3D7
(August 2007) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIÒR Expires: July 31, 2010

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.
UTU-0566

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
Do not use this form for proposals to driH or to re-enter an

abandoned welt Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on page 2. 7. If Unit of CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
RED WASH UNIT

1. Type of Well

Oil Well Gas Well Other NWWe21N2a6re and No.

2. Name of Overator 9. API Well No.
QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY 43-047-15290

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool or Exploratory Area
1EOROEL1y804SO78

435-781-4331 RED WASH

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T.,R.,M, or Survey Description) 11. Country or Parish, State
1980' FSL 1980' FWL NESWSECTION 26, T7S-R23E

UINTAH

12. CHECK THE APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation: Clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof If
the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports must be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 must be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices must be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY (QEP) REQUEST A TA STATUS APPROVAL FOR THIS WELL.

QEP IS RE-EVALUATING THIS WELL FOR POSIBLE WATER INJECTION OR PLUG AND ABANDON.

REQUESTDENIED
Utah Divisionof

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct. Name (Printed/Typed)
JAN NELSO

Title REGULATORY AFFAIRS

Signature Date 03/31/2009

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE
Approved by V

Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice doesnot warrant or certify
that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would Office
entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S,C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any departmentor agency lse,
fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/14/2010

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N5085-QuestarExploration and Production Company N3700-QEP Energy Company

1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265

Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048 Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048

CA No. Unit: RED WASH
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

NO TYPE STATUS
SEE ATTACHED

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/28/2010
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/28/2010
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/24/2010
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Requested
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 8/16/2010 BIA not yet
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 8/16/2010
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 6/29/2010
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/30/2010
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/30/2010
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESBOOOO24
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965010693
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965010695
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a
COMMENTS:

QEP Energy (Red Wash) FORMA.xls



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS ANDMINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER

See attached
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS See attached
T UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° See attacheddrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for suchproposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL
8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL Ü GAS WELL OTHER See attached

2 NAeMEOFO

XPOr tionand Production Company Att che
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:
1050 17th Street, Suite 500 Denver CO z 80265 (303) 672-6900 See attached

4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See attached COUNTY: Attached

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE. MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICEOF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

6/14/2010 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL(SutamitOriginal Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFFDate of work completion:
COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Operator Name

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENTFORMATION Change
12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pemnent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective June 14, 2010 Questar Exploration and Production Company changed its name to QEP Energy Company. This name
change involves only an internal corporate name change and no thirdparty change of operator is involved. The same
employees will continue to be responsible for operations of the properties described on the attached list. All operations willcontinue to be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLMReference No. ESBOOOO24)
Utah State Bond Number: 965666083
Fee Land Bond Number: 303ûù3üü3
BfA Bond Number: TGG446- WP

$~O/o to 13
The attached document is an all inclusive list of the wells operated by Questar Exploration and Production Company. As of
June 14, 2010 QEP Energy Company assumes all rights, duties and obligations as operator of the properties as described onthe list

NAME(PLEASE P Morgan Anderson
TITLE Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATU DATE 6/23/2010

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED APPROVEDÁ/2/ AN9
JUN2 8 2010

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
ÛÎVÎSÎOn of Oil,GasandMining'DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING EarleneRussell, Engineering



Questar ExplorationProduction Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
RED WASH

eñ=ectiveJune 14,2010

well name sec twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease

FER/34-23B 23 070S 230E 4304715136 5670 Federal (TOT P
RTV41-23B 23 070S 230E 4304715138 5670 Federal ONV P
RW 32-22B 22 070S 230E 4304715139 5670 Federal OW P
RW 43-23B 23 070S 230E 4304715140 5670 Federal OW P
RW 32-17C 17 070S 240E 4304715145 5670 Federal OW P
RW 34-26B __ 26 070S 230E 4304715148 5670 Federal GW TA
10%732-14B 14 070S 230E 4304715150 5670 Federed (IRT PIUgr34-14B 14 070S 230E 4304715152 5670 Federed CA¥ S
RW 23-22B 22 070S 230E 4304715153 5670 Federal OW TAICRT43-22B 22 070S 230E 4304715155 5670 Federal ()VV PFCyr32-23B 23 070S 230E 4304715156 5670 Federal Cfür P
R3W23-13B 13 070S 230E 4304715157 5670 Federal GVV Tzt
Flu'34-22B 22 070S 230E 4304715158 5670 Federal ()VV P
IUMT32-13B 13 070S 230E 4304715163 5670 Federed GNV P
RTVl4-23B 23 070S 230E 4304715165 5670 Federal ONV S
RW 14-24A 24 070S 220E 4304715166 17554 Federal OW DRL
IUn'21-24B 24 070S 230E 4304715167 5670 Federed CA¥ TA
RMr34-13B 13 070S 230E 4304715168 5670 Federed ONV P
ICRT21-29C 29 070S 240E 4304715169 5670 Federed GVV P
RW 12-17B 17 070S 230E 4304715170 5670 Federal OW P
RTV32-33C 33 070S 240E 4304715171 5670 Federed GNV P
RNV14-23A 23 070S 220E 4304715176 5670 Federed ONV P
ItWV12-18C 18 070S 240E 4304715183 5670 Federal ()TV P
RMT21-22B 22 070S 230E 4304715186 5670 Federed (ini TA
RMT34-18B 18 070S 230E 4304715189 5670 Federed ONV P
RW 21-27B __ 27 070S 230E 4304715 56 0 _Federal OW TA
FUN23-22/t 22 070S 220E 4304715192 5670 Federal O3W P
RW 21-18C 18 070S 240E 4304715193 5670 Federal OW P
REV12-13B 13 070S 230E 4304715196 5670 Fedend GrlV S
R3¥32-18C 18 070S 240E 4304715198 5670 Federal (iYV P
RIVU77(21-13B) 13 070S 230E 4304715199 5670 Federed ONV P
RNV32-28B 28 070S 230E 4304715200 5670 Federal ONV P
RTV12-27B 27 070S 230E 4304715201 5670 Fedend ONV T'A
RMT14-27B 27 070S 230E 4304715202 5670 Federed CTMT P
FDV41-31B 31 070S 230E 4304715203 5670 Federal ()VV P
RMT41-27A 27 070S 220E 4304715205 5670 Federed ONV S
RMT44-14B 14 070S 230E 4304715206 5670 Federed GBW P
R3¥43-21B 21 070S 230E 4304715211 5670 Federal ()?V P
RTV12-22A 22 070S 220E 4304715213 5670 Federed ONV P
RW 12-22B 22 070S 230E 4304715218 5670 Federal OW P
Flüf34-21B 21 070S 230E 4304715220 5670 Federal ()VV P
RMT34-15B 15 070S 230E 4304715222 5670 Fedend (TR' P
RW 32-21B 21 070S 230E 4304715226 5670 Federal OW P
90W21-28B 28 070S 230E 4304715227 5670 Federal (39V P

Bonds:BLAñ=ESBOOOO24
BIA=956010693

State= 965010695 1 of



Questar ExplorationProduction Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
RED WASH

efectiveJune 14,2010

well name sec twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
leaseRTV23-23A 23 070S 220E 4304715228 5670 Fedend ONV P

RTV32-24A 24 070S 220E 4304715229 5670 Federal ONV P
RTV32-28/t 28 070S 220E 4304715230 5670 Federal ()TV SRV(21-19B 19 070S 230E 4304715233 5670 Fedend ONV Pfin'43-29A 29 070S 220E 4304715236 5670 Fedend CnW S C
RW 23-28B 28 070S 230E 4304715237 17525 Federal OW P CRTVl3-13B 13 070S 230E 4304715238 5670 Federed Gr1V PRyr24-14B 14 070S 230E 4304715239 5670 Federed ONV Pftw/41-29A 29 070S 220E 4304715243 5670 Federed OGV P
RTV14-15B 15 070S 230E 4304715246 5670 Federed 05V P
10%741-34B 34 070S 230E 4304715250 5670 Federed ONV P
RW 41-30B 30 070S 230E 4304715254 5670 Federal OW P
RW 24-22B 22 070S 230E 4304715255 5670 Federal OW P
RTV33-14B 14 070S 230E 4304715257 5670 Federed ONV PECui21-18B 18 070S 230E 4304715258 5670 Federal OVV 134
RW 22-22B_ _ 22 070S 230E 4304715260 5670 Federal OW TA _ C10%T42-14B 14 070S 230E 4304715264 5670 Federal (TET P
RTVl4-29B 29 070S 230E 4304715265 5670 Federed ONV PIUn132-30B 30 070S 230E 4304715268 5670 Federed CA¥ P
RTV32-15B 15 070S 230E 4304715270 5670 Federed ONV P
RW 12-20B 20 070S 230E 4304715272 5670 Federal OW S
FCW'12-28B 28 070S 230E 4304715274 5670 Federal CTYV P
R3N32-26B 26 070S 230E 4304715275 5670 Federal (19V 104
RW 31-28B 28 070S 230E 4304715283 5670 Federal OW TA
FØW34-30B 30 070S 230E 4304715288 5670 Federal (39V P
R3¥23-26B 26 070S 230E 4304715290 5670 Federal (39V S
RV/41-33A 33 070S 220E 4304715294 5670 Federed ONV P
RW 43-24B 24 070S 230E 4304715295 5670 Federal GW TA
ItWV12-14B 14 070S 230E 4304715296 5670 Federal ()NV S
RW 32-28C 28 070S 240E 4304715302 5670 Federal GW P
RW 23-25A 25 070S 220E 4304715305 5670 Federal OW P
RW 41-8F 08 080S 240E 4304720014 5670 Federal |GW
FDW44-21C 21 070S 240E 4304730149 5670 Federal (39V S
RW 13-27B 27 070S 230E 4304730199 5670 Federal OW TA
RM/21-34B 34 070S 230E 4304730258 5670 Federed ONV P
RW 43-26B 26 070S 230E 4304730259 5670 Federal OW TA
RNVl4-18C 18 070S 240E 4304730309 5670 Federed Ogr p
RW 12-26B 26 070S 230E 4304730311 5670 Federal OW TA
ILVV32-24B 24 070S 230E 4304730313 5670 Federal ONV P
RM/34-18C 18 070S 240E 4304730314 5670 Federed ONV P
RM/21-19C 19 _070S 240E 4304730340 5670 Federed GNV P
RM/ 14-25B 25 070S 230E 4304730341 5670 Federal OTV P
RW 32-35B 35 070S 230E 4304730342 5670 ederal OW TA
RMT 12-36B 36 070S 230E 4304730344 5670 Federal ()TV S

Bonds:BLM = ESBOOOO24
BIA= 956010693

State=965010695 2 of



Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
RED WASH

eñectiveJune 14,2010

well name sec twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease |RNV22-14B 14 070S 230_E4304730345 5670 Federed _ONV P

RMT42-13B 13 070S 230E 4304730346 5670 Federed ONV P
RW 23-19C 19 070S 240E 4304730348 5670 Federal GW P
RW 22-18C 18 070S 2 3087 5670 Federal OW P
BOW22-17C 17 070S 240E 4304730388 5670 Federal GNV P
RW 44-26B 26 070S 230E 4304730520 5670 Federal GW P
RW 42-27B 27 070S 230E 4304731051 5670 Federal OW TA
RW 44-27B 27 070S 230E 4304731053 5670 Federal OW TA
RNV44-23B 23 070S 230E 4304731054 5670 Federed GAV P
RNVll-35B 35 070S 230E 4304731079 5670 Federed ONV PFEn122-35B 35 070S 230E 4304731082 5670 Federal ()TV P
FCA'33-23B 23 070S 230E 4304731476 5670 Federal GVV TA
RNVll-24B 24 070S 230E 4304731477 5670 Federed CA¥ PECn142-21B 21 070S 230E 4304731478 5670 Federed ONV P
RNVl3-24B 24 070S 230E 4304731517 5670 Federed CA¥ P
RNV42-23B 23 070S 230E 4304731576 5670 Federed GAV TA
RNVl2-35B 35 070S 230E 4304731578 5670 Federed ONV S
FCW'24-15B 15 070S 230E 4304731579 5670 Federal ONV P
RMT24-18C 18 070S 240E 4304731582 5670 Federed GMT P
RW 43-15B 15 070S 230E 4304731682 17643 Federal GW DRL C
FUn'34-17B 17 070S 230E 4304731819 5670 Federal ONV PEUgr41-4F 04 080S 240E 4304732538 5670 Fedend (iñT TA
RTV23-23C 23 070S 240E 4304732629 5670 Federed GVV P
RIVl4-17B 17 070S 230E 4304732738 5670 Federed ONV P
RW 32-17B 17 070S 230E 4304732981 5670 Federal OW P
RM/32-18B 18 070S 230E 4304733018 5670 Federed ONV P
RNV42-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733490 5670 Federed ONV P
FCW'22-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733491 5670 Federed COW P
RM/24-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733492 5670 Federal ONV P
ICW'22-21B 21 070S 230E 4304733522 5670 Federed ONV S
RW 24-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733523 5670 Federal OW P
RW 44-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733524 5670 Federal OW P
ICW44-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733525 5670 Federed ONV P
RM/24-18B 18 070S 230E 4304733554 5670 Federed ONV P
RW 42-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733556 5670 Federal OW P
RTV22-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733559 5670 Federed ONV P
RW 23-24A 24 070S 220E 4304733567 5670 Federal OW P
RNV42-24A 24 070S 220E 4304733569 5670 Federed ONV P
RW 21-25A 25 070S 220E 4304733576 5670 Federal OW P
RW 41-25A 25 070S 220E 4304733579 5670 Federal OW P
IUn'21-24A 24 070S 220E 4304733592 5670 Federed OM' P
RW 44-18B 18 070S 230E 4304733594 5670 Federal OW
RW 41-24A 24 070S 220E 4304733769 5670 Federal OW P
104'42-30B 30 070S 230E[4304733771 5670 Federed ONV S

Bonds:BLM=ESBOOOO24
BIA= 956010693

State=965010695 3 of



Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
RED WASH

efectiveJune 14,2010

well name see twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease

R3WU44-30B 30 070S 230E 4304733772 5670 Federal ONV P
RNV22-25A 25 070S 220E 4304733786 5670 Federal ONV PPJüf34-27C 27 070S 240E 4304735045 5670 Federal GVV P
RTV3=‡-22C 22 070S 240E 4304735098 5670 Federed GNV P
ÍËVÏ35Ï23rtG 23 070S 220E 4304735668 5670 Federal ()VV P
RWU 32-27AG 27 070S 220E 4304735670 5670 Federal OW P
RW 14-34AMU 34 070S 220E 4304735671 14277 Federal GW P
RW 44-08FG 08 080S 240E 4304736349 15261 Federal GW P
RMT34-34AD 34 070S 220E 4304736351 16177 Federed (TRT P
RW 33-31 BD 31 070S 230E 4304736357 Federal GW APD C
RW 13-31 BD 31 070S 230E 4304736358 Federal GW APD CRMT21-26AI) 26 070S 220E 4304736768 5670 Federed ONV OPS C
RW 43-26AG 26 070S 220E 4304736769 16575 Federal OW OPS C
R3¥43-23/eG 23 070S 220E 4304736770 5670 Federal OTV OPS C
RW 41-26AG 26 070S 220E 4304736818 5670 Federal OW OPS C
RW 04-25B 25 070S 230E 4304736982 17224 Federal OW P
RW 34-27ADR 27 070S 220E 4304739445 16330 Federal GW P
IUM/32-29Cl3 29 070S 240E 4304739854 Federal GVV AdPDi C
IUMT24-10FD 10 080S 240E 4304739963 Federed GAW APD C
RW 34-20CD 20 070S 240E 4304739964 Federal GW APD C
RW 32-20CD 20 070S 240E 4304739965 Federal _GW APD
RW 24-21CD 21 070S 240E 4304739966 Federal GW APD C
R3W41-28Cl3 28 070S 240E 4304739967 Federal CivV AdPD C
RW 41-33CD 33 070S 240E 4304739968 Federal GW APD C
RW 14-35 AMU 35 070S 220E 4304740051 Federal GW APD C
RW 44-35 AMU 35 070S 220E 4304740052 Federal GW APD
RW 12-17FG 17 080S 240E 4304740602 | Federal GW APD C

Bonds:BL.M= ESBOOOO24
BIA= 956010693

State=965010695 4 of



'a United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
TAKE PRIDE'+4N

H µ¢ Utah State Office IN ggg|CA
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
http://www.blm.gov/ut/st/en.html

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3100
(UT-922)

JUL2 8 2010

Memorandum

Fr m:

mal FrieldhOfficePriaceFie ce Mo Fi

Subject: Name Change Recognized

Attached is a copy of the Certificate of Name Change issued by the Texas Secretary of State and
a decision letter recognizing the name change from the Eastern States Office. We have updated
our records to reflect the name change in the attached list of leases.

The name change from QuestarExploration and Production Company into QEP Energy
Company is effective June 8, 2010.

cc: MMS



FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LE E D6EsIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
DRILL form for such proposals. RED WASH

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well RW 23-26B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047152900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 E×t RED WASH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

1980 FSL 1980 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 26 Township: 07.05 Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work wiH start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NANE

11/1/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

O PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: O REPERFORATE CURRENT FORNATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

O TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

O DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

O WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
QEP Energy Company requests approval to deepen the above well to a total
depth of 10,573' to the Mesaverde Formation. In addition, the well pad has

been modified to accomodate the larger drill rig and the Surface Use Plan has
been revised to address all other changes. The ammended footages are:

1979'FSL, 1979' FWL. Please refer to the following plans: Surface Use Plan,
8-Point Drilling Plan, Plat Package, Weed Data Sheet. Approvedby the

Utah Divisionof
&4R PM Oil,Gas and Mining

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Valyn Davis 435 781-4369 Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



T'7S, R23E, S.L.B.&M QEP ENERGY COMPANY
Well location, RW #23-268 (RE-ENTRY), located
as shown in the NE 1/4 SW 1/4 of Section 26,
T7S, R23E S.L.B.&M. Uintoh County, Utoh.N89'51'59"E - 26J7.84' (Meas.) N89°51'04"E

- 26J9.61' (Meas.) ' '
sy see,i saa rese erass cap, rese erass co; * '

BASIS OF ELEVATION1.J' High, 2 1/2•
Scottered Stones

0.'4
High, Mound

BENCH MARK 20EAM LOCATEDIN THE SE 1/4 OF SECTION
35, TSS, R21E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE OURAY SE,
QUADRANGLE,UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5 MtNUTEQUAD
(TOPOGRAPHiCMAP) PUBLISHEDBY THE UNITEDSTATES
DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR,GEOLOGICALSURVEY. SAID
ELEVATION IS MARKEDAS BEING 4697 FEET.

--- BASIS OF BEARINGS
BASIS OF BEARINGSIS A G.P.S. OBSERVATlON.

19J6 Brass Cap
0.8' High, Mound19J6 Brass Cup, of StonesFlush W/ Ground

o o1979'
RW j'2J-26Ð (RE-ENTRY)
Elev. Ungraded Ground = 5508'

scALE
-----

CERTil9CATE
THIS IS TO CERTlFYTHAT THE ABC PLAT WAS R$EPARED FROM
FIELDNOTES OF ACTUALSUlìVEY&MADEBY ME ÒRN R MY
SUPERVISION AND THAT THE EAMËA TRUE AND'C CT TO THE
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND 8Ë

19J6 Brass Cap,
, , -, i.Ðent Over, Set

REGISTEREDLANDJORY
19J Brass Cap Alum. Cap /7JSJP4

ts]6 Brass Cop REGISTRATl0N tW 161

SB951'49"W - 2638.74' (Meas.) SBS52'JO"W - 26JS.81' (Meas.)
UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078

(435) 789-1017LEGEND: (NAD 83) SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:LATlTUDE = 40'10'43.46" (40.178739) 1" = 1000' 10-15-10 11-03-10=
90° SYMBOL LONGITUDE= 109°17'48.06"

(109.296683) PARTY REFERENCES(NAD 27) A.F. J.C. C.H. G.L.O. PLAT
= PROPOSED WELL HEAD.

LATITUDE = 40'10'43.59" (40.178775) WEATHER FILEA = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGlTUDE= 109'17'45.61" (109.296003) COOL QEP ENERGY



QEP Energy Company
RW 23-26B Drilling Prog
API: 43-047-15290
Summarized Re-Entry Procedure

1. Clear locationof all unnecessary equipment.
2. MIRU pulling unit.
3. ND tubinghead,NU BOP's (3M).
4. Kill well if necessary.
5. POOHwith all existingproductionequipmentand tubing.
6. Completions will prep well for re-entry.

7. POOH.
8. ND BOP's
9. RD pulling unit, move off location.
10. MIRU drilling rig.

I l. NU rig's SM BOPE.
12. Drill out shoe and down to 10,573'.
13. Log well. Triple or Quad-Combo (GR,NEU/DEN, IND, RES, SON)
14. RIH with 4-1/2" 11.6# HCP-110 casing and cement.
15. ND BOP's.
16.



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY
RW 23-26B (API#: 43-047-15290)

RE-ENTRY DRILLINGPROGRAM

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore

Federal Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil & Gas No. 1, and
the approved plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of its
subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to
insure compliance.

1. Formation Tops

The estimated top of importantgeologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth, TVD & MD
Green River 2,671'
Mahogany 3,440'
Original TD 5,526'
Wasatch 5,984'
Mesaverde 8,208'
Sego 10,476'
TD 10,576'

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil, Gas, Water, and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top of the anticipated water, oil, gas, or other
mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered as follows:

Substance Formation Depth, TVD & MD
Gas Wasatch 5,984'
Gas Mesaverde 8,208'
Gas Sego 10,476'

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling
will be recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be
tested to determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal,
Utah. Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If flows are
detected, samples will be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses
conducted. Fresh water will be obtained from Wonsits Valley water right A36125
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ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY
RW 23-26B (API#: 43-047-15290)

(which was filed on May 7, 1964) or Red Wash water right # 49-2153 (which was
filed on March 25, 1960). It was determined by the Fish and Wildlife Service that
any water right number filed before 1989 is not depletingto the Upper Colorado
River System, to supply fresh water for drilling purposes. All water resulting
from drilling operations will be disposed of at Red Wash Central Battery Disposal
site; SWSE, Section 27, T7S, R23E or Wonsits Valley Disposal Site; SWNW,
Section 12, TSS, R21E.

3. Operator's Specification for Pressure Control Equipment

A. 7 1/16" or 11" as available 5000 psi double ram with blind rams and pipe
rams, annular preventer and drilling spool or BOP with 2 side outlets.

B. All BOP connections subject to pressure shall be flanged, welded or clamped.

C. Kill line (2" min), 2 choke line valves (3" min), choke line (3" min), 2 kill line
valves (2" min) and a check valve, 2 chokes with one remotely controlled
from rig floor and a pressure gauge on choke manifold.

D. Upper and Lower Kelly cock valves with handlesand safety valve and subs to
fit all drill string connections.

E. IBOP or float sub available.

F. Fill up line must be installed above the uppe1most preventer.

G. Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved
stack working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 50 percent of internal
yield pressure of casing whichever is less. BOP and related equipment shall
meet the minimum requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 for
equipment and testing requirements, procedures, etc..., for a 5M system and
individualcomponents shall be operable as designed.

4. Casing Design:

Hole Csg. Top Bottom Wt. Grade Thread Cond. Expected
Size Size (MD) (MD) MW(ppg)

13 ¾" 10 ¾" sfc 231' 40.5# J-55 STC Existing N/A
9" 7" sfc 5,526' 23# J-55 LTC Existing N/A

6 1/8" 4 1/2" sfc 10,573' 11.6# HCP-110 LTC New 8.8 -9.6

Page 2 of



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY
RW 23-26B (API#: 43-047-15290)

Casing Strengths: Collapse Burst Tensile (min)

10 ¾" 40.5# J-55 STC 1,580 psi 3,130 psi 420,000 lb.
7" 23# J-55 LTC 3,270 psi 4,360 psi 313,000 lb.

4 1/2" 11.6# HCP-110 LTC 8,830 psi 10,710 psi 279,000 lb.

Casing Design Factors
Burst: 1.1
Collapse: 1.1
Tension: 1.4

Maximum anticipated mud weight: 10.5 ppg
Maximum anticipatedsurface treatingpressure: 7,200 psi

5. Cementing Program

4-1/2" Production Casing:

Lead Slurry: 3,000' (TOC) - 5,526'. 90 sks (279 ft') Halliburton Extendacem, 3
pps Silicalite (extender), 1 pps Granulite TR ¼ (LCM), 0.125 pps Poly - E -

Flake. SlurryWeight 11.0 lb/gal, 3.18 ft'/sk, 0% excess

Tail Slurry: 5,526' -- 10,573'. 350 sks (597 ft'), Halliburton Expandacem, 0.2%
Super CBL (Expander), 0.45% HR-5 (Retarder), l pps Granulite TR ¼, 0.125 pps
Poly-E-Flake (LCM). Slurry Weight 13.5 lb/gal, 1.71 ft'/sk, 25% excess over
gauge open hole.

*Final cement volumes to be calculated from caliper log and will attempt to pump
cement to 3,000'.

6. Auxiliary Equipment

A. Kelly Cock - yes

B. Float at the bit - yes

C. Monitoring equipment on the mud system - PVT/FlowShow

D. Full opening safety valve on the rig floor - yes

E. Drilling below the 7" casing will be done with water based mud.
Maximum anticipated mud weight is 10.5 ppg.

Page 3 of



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY
RW 23-26B (API#: 43-047-15290)

F. No minimum quantity of weight material will be required to be kept on
location.

G. Gas detector will be used from intermediate casing depth to TD.

7. Testing, logging and coring program

A. Cores - none.

B. DST - none anticipated

C. Logging - Mud logging - Intermediate Casing to TD
OH Logs: GR-SP-Induction, Neutron Density.

D. Formation and Completion Interval:
- Stimulation will be designed for the particular area of interest as
encountered.

8. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential
Hazards

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. Maximum anticipated
bottom hole pressure equals approximately 5,773 psi. Maximum anticipated
bottom hole temperatureis 210° F.

H2S has not been encountered in other wells drilled to similar depths in the
general area.

Page 4 of



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY
RW 23-26B (API#: 43-047-15290)
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ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDERNO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY
RW 23-26B (API#: 43-047-15290)
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UpdatedMPG12 15-2010

RW23-268
API#43-047-16290

NESWSec28T7SR23E
UintahCounty,Utah

KB5,522' 10-3/4"40;S#J-55
GL5,508' Set@231

OligInalSpud01/04/1963

Perfs:

4402'-4406'
4441'-4446'
4S69'-4574'
4584'-4588'
4648'-4652'
4707-4710

4716'4727
5246'-5250
5276'-5284
5304'-5306
5310'-5313
5326'-5332'
6361'-5366'
5406'-5409'
5432'-5436'

PBTD@5,478'

k TD@5,626'
? 23#J-55Set@5,526' 6 1/8"OH

4 1/2"11.6#HCP-110



QEP ENERGY COMPANY
RW 23-26B

1979' FSL 1979' FWL
NESW, SECTION 26, T7S, R23E

UINTAHCOUNTY, UTAH
LEASE # UTU-0566

ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1
MULTI- POINT SURFACE USE & OPERATIONS PLAN

An onsite inspection was conducted for the RW 23-26B on April 13, 2011. Weather
conditions were sunny at the time of the onsite. In attendance at the inspection were
the following individuals:

Kevin Sadlier Bureau of Land Management
Aaron Roe Bureau of Land Management
HollyVilla Bureau of Land Management
Daniel Emmett Bureau of Land Management
Jan Nelson QEP Energy Company
Stephanie Tomkinson QEP Energy Company
Ryan Angus QEP Energy Company
Valyn Davis QEP Energy Company
Eric Wickersham QEP Energy Company
Andy Floyd Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying

1. Existinq Roads:

The proposed well site is approximately 25 miles South of Vernal, Utah.

Refer to Topo Maps A and B for location of access roads within a 2 -- mile radius.

Allexisting roads willbe maintainedand kept in good repair during allphases of
operation.

2. Planned Access Roads:

Please refer to QEP Energy Company Greater Deadman Bench EIS UTU-080-200-
0369V Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

Refer toTopo Map B for the location of the proposed access road.

No new access road is proposed. The access to be used is theaccess to the
existing RW 23-268 Iocation. Graveling or capping the roadbed willbe performed as
necessary to provide a well constructed safe road. Should conditions warrant, rock,
gravel or culverts willbe installed as needed.

3. Location of Existinq Wells Within a 1 -- Mile Radius:

Please refer to Topo Map



4. Location of Existinq & Proposed Facilities:

Please refer to QEP Energy Company Greater Deadman Bench EIS UTU-080-200-
0369V Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

The followingguidelines willapply ifthewell is productive.

A containment dike willbe constructed completely around those production facilities
which contain fluids (i.e., production tanks,produced water tanks). These dikes will
be constructed of compacted impervious subsoil; hold 110% of the capacity of the
largest tank;and, be independent of the back cut. Ifa Spill Prevention, Control, and
Countermeasure (SPCC) Plan is required by the Environmental Protection Agency,
the containmentdike may be expanded to meet SPCC requirementswithapproval
by the BLM/VFOAO. The specificAPD willaddress additional capacity ifsuch is
needed due to environmentalconcerns. The use of topsoilfor the construction of
dikes willnot be allowed.

AIIloading lines willbe placed insidethe berm surroundingthe tankbatteries.

AIIpermanent (on site six months or longer) above the ground structures
constructed or installed, including pumping units,willbe painted a color approved
by the State.

It was determined on the onsite by the BLMVFO AO that the facilities willbe
painted Covert Green.

Refer toTopo Map D for the location of the proposed pipeline.

Allexistingequipmentwillbe moved offlocation before any construction begins.

The proposed surface pipeline willbe constructed utilizingexisting disturbed areas
to minimize surface disturbance. No construction activities willbe allowed outside
of the permitted ROW area.

Prior to construction,the Permittee willdevelop a plan of installation to minimize
surface disturbance. Pipe willbe strung along the ROW with either a flatbed trailer
and rubber tiredbackhoe or a trackedtypedside boom. Where surface conditions
do not allowthe pipe to be strung along the ROW using conventional methods, the
Permittee willutilize pull sections to run the fabricated pipe throughthearea from
central staging areas along the ROW.

Upon completion of stringing activities the Permittee willfabricate the pipeline on
wooden skids adjacent to the centerline of the ROW using truckmounted welding
machines. Allfabricated piping willbe lowered offof the wooden skids and placed
along the ROW centerline. Upon completion of all activities, the wooden skids will
be removed from the ROW using a flatbed truckor flatbed truckand trailer.
When the surface terrainprohibits the Permittee from safely installing the pipeline
along the permitted ROW, grading of the permitted ROW willbe required. Prior to
installing the pipeline in these areas a plan willbe developed to safely install the
pipeline while minimizinggrading activitiesand surface disturbances.



erosion control Best Management Practices willbe installed as needed prior to the
start of any grading activities. Surface grading willbe limited towhat is needed to
safely install the pipeline. Tracktype bulldozers and tracktype backhoes will be
utilized for grading activities.

Upon completion of the pipeline installation, the permitted ROW willbe restored to
the pre-disturbance surface contours.

The proposed pipeline willbe a surface 10" or smaller, 2,688' in length, containing
1.85 acres.

Road Crossings

Fusion Bond or concrete coated pipe willbe used for all road crossings to alleviate
future corrosion.

Allpipe and fittings used for road crossings willbe prefabricated within the
proposed ROW to minimize the duration of open pipe trenchacross the roadway.
Pipe used for road crossings willbe isolated on each end with a flange set and
insulation kit and cathodically protected with a magnesium typeanode. Adequately
sized equipment willbe used for minorand major road crossings. Depth of cover
for minor roads willbe >4' and the depth of cover for major roads willbe >6'.

Prior to lowering the pipe in the trench,the Permittee will"Jeep" the pipe to locate
and repair any Holidays in the pipe coating. Upon lowering the pipe in the trench,
6" of bedding and a minimumof 6" of shading willbe installed to protect the pipe
using either nativesoils <1" in diameter or imported sand. Pipe trenchesthat
extend across gravel roads willbe backfilled with native soils to within 8" of the
driving surface and capped with 3/4" road base. Pipe trenchesthatextend across
asphalt paved roads willbe backfilled to 4" of the driving surface with 3/4" road base
and capped asphalt material.

5. Location and Type of Water Supply:

Please refer to QEP Energy Company Greater Deadman Bench EIS UTU-080-200-
0369V Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

Water for drillingpurposes wouldbe obtained from Wonsits Valley Water Right # A
36125 (whichwas filed on May 7, 1964) or Red Wash Water Right #49-2153
(which was filed on March 25, 1960). Itwas determined by the Fish and Wildlife
Service thatany water right number filed before 1989 is not depleting to the Upper
Colorado River System.

6. Source of Construction Materials:

Please refer to QEP Energy Company Greater Deadman Bench EIS UTU-080-200-
0369V Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

Surface and subsoil materials in the immediate area willbe utilized.

Any gravel willbe obtained from a commercial



The use of materials under BLMjurisdictionwillconformto 43 CFR 3610.2-3.

7. Methods of Handlinq Waste Materials:

Please refer to QEP Energy Company Greater Deadman Bench EIS UTU-080-200-
0369V Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

Drill cuttings willbe contained and buried in the reserve pit.

Drilling fluids including salts and chemicals willbe contained in the reserve pit.
Upon terminationof drillingand completionoperations, the liquid contents of the
reserve pit willbe used at the next drillsite or willbe removed and disposed of at an
approved waste disposal facilitywithin 6 months after drilling is terminated.
Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons in the pit shall be removed in
accordance with43 CFR 3162.7-1.

Unless specified in the site specific APD, the reserve pit willbe constructed on the
location and willnot be located within natural drainages, where a flood hazard exists
or surface runoff willor damage the pit walls. The reserve pit willbe constructed so
that itwillnot leak, break, or allow discharge of liquids.

Itwillbe determined at the on-site inspection ifa pit liner is necessary, the reserve
pit willbe lined with a synthetic reinforced liner, a minimumof 20 millimeters thick,
with sufficientbedding used to cover any rocks. The liner willoverlap the pit walls
and be covered withdirtand/or rocks to hold it in place.

No trashor scrap willbe disposed of in the pit.

Reserve pit leaks are considered an undesirable event and willbe orallyreported to
the AO.

After first production, produced wastewater willbe confinedto the approved pit or
storage tankfor a period not to exceed 90 days.

After the 90 day period, the produced water willbe contained in tanks on location
and thenhauled by truckto one of the followingpre-approved disposal sites:

Red Wash disposal welf located in the NESW, Section 28, T7S, R22E,
Red Wash disposal well located in the NESW, Section 28, T7S, R22E,
West End Disposal located in the NESE, Section 28, T7S, R22E,
or approved third-partysurface evaporative pits.

Produced water, oil,and other byproducts willnot be applied to roads or well pads
for the controlof dust or weeds. The dumping of produced fluids on roads, well
sites, or other areas willnot be allowed.

Any spills of oil,gas, salt water, or other noxious fluids willbe immediately cleaned
up and removed to an approved disposal site. The spillswillbe reported to the AO
and other authorities as



A chemicalporta-toilet willbe furnished with the drillingrig. The chemical porta-
toiletwastes willbe hauled toAshley Valley Sewer and Water System for disposal.

Garbage, trash,and other waste materials willbe collected in a portable, self-
contained, fullyenclosed trashcage during operations. Trash willnot be burned on
location. AIIdebris and other waste material not contained in the trashcage willbe
cleaned up and removed from the location immediately after removal of the drilling
rig. AIItrash and waste materialwillbe hauled to the Uintah County Landfill.

No chemicals subject to reportingunder SARA Title III(hazardous materials) in an
amount greater than 10,000 pounds willbe used, produced, stored, transported,or
disposed of annually in association withthe drilling,testing,or completingof wells.
Furthermore, extremely hazardous substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in
thresholdplanning quantities, willnot be used, produced, stored, transported,or
disposed of in association with the drilling, testing,or completing of wells within
these areas. Specific APD's shall address any modificationsfrom this policy.

8. Ancillary Facilities:

None anticipated.

9. Well Site Layout: (See Location Layout Diagram)

The attached Location Layout Diagram describes drillpad cross-sections, cuts and
fills and locations of the mud tanks, reserve pit, flare pit, pipe racks, trailerparking,
spoil dirt stockpile(s), and surface material stockpile(s).

Please see the attached diagram rigorientation, parking areas, and access roads,
as well as the location of the following:

The stockpiled topsoil(first six inches), willnot be used for facilityberms. AII
brush removed from thewell pad during construction willbe stockpiled with
topsoil.

The flare pit or flare box willbe located downwind from the prevailing wind
direction.

Any drainage thatcrosses thewell location willbe diverted around the location
by using ditches, water diversion drains or berms. Ifdeemed necessary at the
on-site, erosion drains may be installed to contain sediments that could be
produced from access roads and well locations.

The reserve pit.

A pit liner is required. A felt pit liner willbe required ifbedrock is encountered.

10. Fencinq Requirements:

Any open pits will be fenced during the operations. The fencing will be maintained
until such timeas the pits are



All pits willbe fenced accordingto the followingminimumstandards:

39 inch net wire willbe used with at least one strand of barbed wire on top of the
net wire. Barbed wire is not necessary if pipe or some typeof reinforcement rod
is attached to the top of the entire fence.

The net wire shall be no more than two inches above the ground. The barbed
wire shall be three inches over the net wire. Total height of the fence shall be at
least 42 inches.

Corner posts shall be cemented and/or braced in such a manner to keep the
fence tightat all times.

Standard steel, wood, or pipe posts shall be used between the corner braces.
Maximum distance between any 2 fence posts shall be no greater than 16 feet.

AIIwire shall be stretched using a stretching device before it is attached to corner
posts.

The reserve pit willbe fenced on three (3) sides during drillingoperations. The
fourth side willbe put in place when the rig moves off location. The pit willbe
fenced and maintaineduntil it is backfilled. Ifdrillingoperations does not
commence within 3 days, the fourth side of the fence willbe installed

11. Plans for Reclamation of the Surface:

Please refer to QEP Energy Company Uinta Basin Division Reclamation Plan

Site Specific Procedures:

Site Specific Reclamation Summary:

Reclamation willfollowQuestar Exploration and Production Company, Uinta Basin
Division's Reclamation Plan, September 2009 (Questar's Reclamation Plan) and the
BLMGreen River District Reclamation Guidelines.

Alltrash and debris willbe removed from the disturbed area.

The disturbed area willbe backfilled withsubsoil.

Topsoil willbe spread to an even, appropriate depth and disked ifneeded.

Water courses and drainages willbe restored.

Erosion control devices willbe installed where needed.

Seeding willbe done in the fall, prior to ground freeze up.

Seed mix willbe submitted to a BLMAO for approval prior to seeding.

Monitoring and reporting willbe conducted as stated in Questar's Reclamation Plan.
A reference site has been established and is included in this



It was determined and agreed upon that there is 4" inches of top soil.

12. Surface Ownership:

Bureau of Land Management
170 South 500 East
Vernal, Utah 84078
(435) 781-4400

13. Other Information:

A Class IIIarchaeological survey was conducted by Montgomery Archaeology
Consultants. A copy of this report was submitted on December 15, 2010, Moac
Report No. 10-237 by Montgomery Archaeology Consultants. Cultural resource
clearance was recommended for this location.

A Class Illpaleontological survey was conducted by Intermountain Paleo
Consulting. A copy of this report was submitted on December 16, 2010, IPC # 10-
226 by Stephen D. Sandau. The inspection resulted in the location of no fossil
resources. However, ifvertebrate fossil(s) are found during construction a
paleontologist should be immediately notified. QEP willprovide Paleo monitor if



Additional Operator Remarks

QEP Energy Company proposes to deepen the existing well bore for the RW 23-26B and drill
to a depth of 10,573' to test the Mesa Verde Formation. Ifproductive, casing willbe run and
the well completed. If dry, the well will be plugged and abandoned as per BLMand State of
Utah requirements"

Please see Onshore Order No. 1.

Please refer to QEP Energy Company Greater Deadman Bench
EIS UT-080-2003-0369V Record of Decision dated March31, 2008.

Please be advised thatQEP Energy Company agrees to be responsible under the termsand
conditions of the lease for the operations conducted upon the lease lands.

Bond coverage for this well is provided by Bond No.ESBOOOO24.The principal is QEP
Energy Company via surety as consent as provided for the 43 CFR



OEP ENERGY COMPANY
RW #23-26B (RE-ENTRY)

LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
SECTION 26, T7S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #5 TO LOCATION STAKE CAhíERA ANGLE SOUTHEASTERLY

PHOTO: VIEW OF EXISTING ACCESS CAMERA ANGLE: SOUTHWESTERLY

LOCATIONPHOTos 10 26 10 PHOTO
85 South 200 East Vemal, Utah 84078 MONTII DAY YEAR

s¡.2, in _ (435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813 TAKENBY:A.F. DR.WNBY:J.L.G.



QEP ENERGY COMPANY FIGURE #
LOCATION LAYOUT FOR SCALE: 1" = 50'

DATE: 11-03-10
RW //23-26B (RE-ENTRY)

DRAWN BY: C.H.
SECTION 26, T7S, R23E, S.L.B.&M. EV: 04-21-11

1979' FSL 1979' FWL

e Existing

R Pit /s to be

Ro d

/ocated a m/n. of 100 istine 7 GRADE i '
trom the ad -,

E/. 506 0

- 6 \01 Anchor

\ E 507 4
"C-16.4 C-1.o' C-1.5'

ReseRE Pirs e (stm. Pi0 a sozo E/. 50 S'
Toto t p c/ty C D
W// of Freaboard

r al P i 5' 60 Sto. 2 00
- 27o cu vos .

Sta. 1+75

m. E/. 500.2

Ancher
xisting o Anchor

prse

Approx Existing /Top of \ Swa a or
Cut Slope Cn 4.1'

Elev. L/cgraded Ground At Loc. Stoke - 550.7.5' UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
FIN/SHED GRADE ELER AT LOC. STAKE = 5506.0' 85 So, ß00 East * Vernal, Utale 84078 * (436)



QEP ENERGY COMPANY FICURE #2x-section TYPICAL CROSS SECTIONS FOR
scale

RW //23-26B (RE-ENTRY)
1" = 50' SECTION 26, T7S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

DATE: 11-03-10
1979' FSL 1979' FWLDRAWN BY: C.H.

REV: 04-21-11

S/ e = 1 1,/2: 1

STA. 2+59 IAN

No. 16131 A
45' 12' 38' 60' •• tu

a' RO

STA. 2+00

45' 12' 38' 60'

Fin/sh Gro
I

CUT - - ---- P nstruction

I
95' 60'

I ÛUT-

STA. 0+00
APPROX/MATE ACREAGES

EX/ST/HG DISTURBANCE
NOTE. IV/7H/HPROPOSED WELLS/TE = ± 0.6]S ACRES

I
'

REMA/N/HG PROPOSED
Topsoil should not be WELLS/TE O/STURBANCE = ± 0.619 ACRES * NO1E
Stripped Below Finished P/PEL/NE O/STURBANCE = ±1.851 ACRES EILL QUANT/7Y /NCLUDES
Grade on Substructure Area. 5% FOR COMPACT/0NTOTAL= ± J.108 ACRES

APPROXIMATEYARDAGES EXCESS MATERIAL = 480 Cu. Yds.
Topsoil & Pit Backfill = 480 Cu. Yds.

(6") Topsoil Stripping = J40 Cu. Yds. (1/2 Pit Vol.)
(New Construction Only)

EXCESSUNBALANCE = 0 Cu.Yds.Rernoining Location = 2,200 Cu. Yds. (After Interirn Rehabilitation)
TOTALCUT = 2,540 CU.YDS· UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
FILL = 2,060 CU.YDS. as so. zoo rase « vernae, oratee4ove • (<ss)



QEP ENERGY COMPANY FIGURE #3
TYPICAL RIG LAYOUT FOR

SCALE: 1" = 50'
RW #23-26B (RE-ENTRY) DATE: 11-03-10

SECTION 26, T7S, R23E, S.L.B.&M. DRAWNBY: C.H.

1979' FSL 1979' FWL

04-25-11

- ( DOGHOUSE
45 36' 60'

RIG

PUM

MUDSHED ¯

TOILET

HOPPER

POWER

Existing b
Access Road TOOLS

FUEL

ST AGE

UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
85 So. ß00 ßest * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (486)



QEP ENERGY COMPANY /FIGURE #4
PRODUCTION FACILITY LAYOUT FOR

SCALE: 1" = 50'
RW #23-26B (RE-ENTRY) DATE: 11-03-10

SECTION 26, T7S, R23E, S.L.B.&M. DRAWN BY: C.H.
REV: 04-21-11

1979' FSL 1979' FWL

04-25-11

Access Road BERM

RE-HABBEDAREA UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
86 So. 200 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (435)



QEP ENERGY COMPANY
RW #23-26B (RE-ENTRY)

SECTION 26, T7S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY,THEN SOUTHERLY DIRECTION FROM VERNAL,
UTAH ALONG U.S. HIGHWAY 40 APPROXIMATELY 3.9 MILES TO THE
JUNCTION OF STATE HIGHWAY 45; EXIT RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 17.1 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF
THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE EAST; TURN LEFT AND
PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 2.6 MILES TO THE
JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTH; TURN
RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 1.1
MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE
SOUTHEAST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 0.6 MILES TO THE PROPOSED LOCATION

TOTAL DISTANCE FROM VERNAL, UTAH TO THE PROPOSED WELL
LOCATION IS APPROXIMATELY 25.3





PROPOSED LO CATI 3N

LEGEND: QEP ENERGY COMPANY
nwrmanoAv N RW #23-26B (RE-ENTRY)

-------- - ruorosro Aceras noAn SECTION 26, T7S, R23E, S.L.B.& AL
1979' FSL 1979' FWL

A Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I C 10 26 10 i a
85 Sotatla 200 Enst Verwant, Utala 84078 Al A Ÿ DAY YEAR

(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
SCALE:I"=200Œ DRAWNBY:J.L.G



T7S

LEGEND: QEP ENERGY COMPANY
f NONSAL WELLS '?TKtER YÆLIß N RW #23-26B (RE-ENTRY)
e monuemovau-s § Anwoonsovmus SECTION 26, T7S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.
# SHOT U WELE & mŒnPRE,Y ABOD NED 1979' FSL 1979' FWL

A Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I t' I O 26 1
BS South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 $1 A Ÿ DAY YEAR

(435) 78¾.1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
SCALE:1"-2000' DRAWilBY:JLC



We Il

TU 0560

. ROAD CROSSING
LATITUDE: 40.178875
LONGITUDE: 100.200380

PROPOSE ) LOCATION:
r RW #23-2f B (RE-ENTRY)

I Well

APPROXE\I \TE TOTAL PIPELINE DISTANCE = 2,688' -

LEGEND: QEP ENERGY COMPANY
----- xxtenworiverin N RW #23-262 (RE-ENTRY)
222222222 . ,,,,,,,,, SECTION 26, T7S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

PROPOSED ACCEss 1979' FSL 1979' FWL

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I C 1 2 10
85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078

(-135) 789-1617 * 1½X (-L35) 784-1813
SCALE:T'-K DROVNBY:J.LGREVISED:lM1111



QEP ENERGY COMPANY
REFERENCE MAP AREA OF VEGETATION

RW #23-26B (RE-ENTRY)
LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

SECTION 26, T7S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

NOTE:
BEGINNING OF REPERENCE AREA
(NAD 83)
UTM NORTH ING: 1469G374.113
UTM EASTING: 2116045.078
LATITUDE: 40.178726
LONGITUDE: -109.297589

"Ì END OF REFERENCE AREA
(NAD 83)
UTM NORTH ING: 14696231.788
UTM EASTING: 2116805.756
LATITUDE: 40.178342
LONGITUDE: -100.290007

PHOTO: VIEW FROM BEGINNING OF REFERENCE AREA

BEGINN NO OF

EMISTING

ENDAOPREPERENCE

SECTION 20

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying SCAIÆ:1"=300' 04 2 1 11
85 South 200 East VemaLUtah 84078 mv vra REF.

. . (435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813 TAKENBY:A.E DREVNBY:J.LG



WEED DATA SHEET

PROJECT NAME: A) O 3 ~Ñ// Ô DATE: Ñ- /3 ~//

SURVEYOR: Stephanie Tomkinson

Location Site Description Weed Species Cover Pattern Infestation
GPS Coordinates Class or Size (aeres)

Number
1
2
3
4
8
6
7

SITE DRAWING (Optional): Includea sketch of theinicatadon within the project area. Count thenumber of individuals if possible.

Cover Class-estimatedpercen cover, byspecies,ofthe infestation Cheaigrass canopycover:0 = No weedsfound
I -Less than1%(trace) Russian thistle canopy eever:
2 = One to five% (low-occasional plants)
3 = Sixto twenty-five%(moderate-scattered plants) Halogeten canopycover:4 - Twenty-fiveto 100% (high- fairlydense)

*Pattern - pattemof theinfestation Kochis canopycover: i0 = Noweedsfound
ngleplantor smanareaofmany plants

.

3 = Patchy
4 = Block

*Infestation Size -number of estimatedacresof theinfestation
0 = No weedsfound
1 = Lessthanone



UK)RKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 04/27/2011 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-15290

WELL NAME: RW 23-26B

OPERATOR: QEP ENERGY COMPANY ( N3700 ) PHONE NUMBER: 435-781-4369

CONTACT: VALYN DAVIS

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
NESW 26 070S 230E .Tech Review Initials Date
SURFACE: 1979 FSL 1979 FWL

BOTTOM: 1979 FSL 1979 FWL Engineering

COUNTY: UINTAH
Geology

LATITUDE: 40.17878 LONGITUDE: -109.29598

UTM SURF EASTINGS:645082 NORTHINGS: 4448782 Surface

FIELD NAME: RED WASH ( 665 )

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal

LEASE NUMBER: U-0566 PROPOSED FORMATION: MVRD

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal COALBED METHANE WELL? NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

/" Plat R649-2-3.

g/' Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[]
Unit: RED WASH

(No. ESBOOOO24 )
Á Potash (Y/N) R649-3-2. General

LÍ Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

v/' Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception

(No. 49-2153 )
t'Drilling UnitgÁ RDCC Review (Y/N)

Board Cause No: L(Date:
Eff Date: ) fg.

N A Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting·c
( N5

¶lW Intent to Commingle (Y/N) R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:

STIPULATIONS:
-r cl< -10



RM122B(24-23g) RW24288 RW442ae APINumber:4304715290RWS4·228 4304730217 4304730249 4304731054 RWid-2de
430471515 RW44-228 RW14-23B RW34-238 4304T16472 Well Name: RW 23-26B

4304730202 gg 4304715f65 4304715130 422 Township TO.7 . Range R2.3 . Section 26
Meridian: SLBM

- --- - -- -- -- - ¯¯¯

Operator: QEP ENERGY COMPANY-- -- RW41-25B
4304715135 RWU 281111-258)

2304731070 Map Prepared:
RW41-27B i

RW11·28 RW21-268 RWal-26e Map Produced by Diana Mason
NW31-278 430471647 4304731076 4364716107 4304731077
4304730200

s1Anis elatus
Acnve * Aeo Amme..a

RWei-258G y--jEwtonsrany @ one mori scom -o

4304736083 cassronAos f om emo
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4304715187 e i 4304730311 4304731080 .....a.

26 28
27

RW13-2BB RYW274 (12-258)

4304730622 4304/31083 -.ly-..t..

RED WASH UNIT -..sa--

RED WASH FIELD RW43·26B
4204730259

RWC4-258
4304730952

RW 04-268G
430473ôt04

Location Map
RWS426B RW14-25B

RW44-276 RW14-268 4304715148 4504 0341
R 34 g 4304731063

. 4304730257 W 4 - !==rit

RW43278
4304746480 na

R 4 2 ( DG 43 04 2
rna

RW41358
4304750343 sa.iJune

34 -
Rwo1-Sida
4304736968

5512-66Ê RW22358 RW42358 L. g44
04131578 4304731082 4304731081 -

BW32·35B p 4,100 eso a 11eoFeer

4304730342
1



United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office

P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3160
(UT-922)

May 12, 2011

Memorandum

To: Assistant District Manager Minerals, Vernal District

From: Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer

Subject: 2011 Plan of Development Red Wash Unit,
Uintah County, Utah.

Pursuant to email between Diana Whitney, Division of Oil, Gas and
Mining, and Mickey Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land
Management, the following wells are planned for re-entry,
deepening and completion in the Mesaverde Formation. The work is
planned for calendar year 2011 within the Red Wash Unit, Uintah
County, Utah.

API# WELLNAME LOCATION

(Proposed PZ Mesaverde)

43-047-15152 RW 34-14B 0609 FSL 2027 FEL Sec 14 TO7S R23E
43-047-15148 RW 34-26B 0761 FSL 1983 FEL Sec 26 TO7S R23E
43-047-15275 RW 32-26B 1996 FNL 2045 FEL Sec 26 TO7S R23E
43-047-15290 RW 23-26B 1979 FSL 1979 FWL Sec 26 TO7S R23E
43-047-16498 RW 41-14B 0746 FNL 0663 FEL Sec 14 TO7S R23E
43-047-15296 RW 12-14B 1838 FNL 0761 FWL Sec 14 TO7S R23E
43-047-16495 RW 41-15B 0661 FNL 0660 FEL Sec 15 TO7S R23E

This office has no objection to permitting the wells at this
time.

Digitally signed byMkhael L Coulthard

IIh hdMO L * DN:cn=MichaelL.Coulthard,o=BureauofLandManagement,IC Be . LOU t af ou=BranchofMinerals,emall=MichaelCoulthard@blm.gov,c=US
Date:2011.05.1208AS:25-06'00'

bcc: File - Red Wash Unit
Division of Oil Gas and Mining
Central Files
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron

MCoulthard:mc:



'
State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER

GARY R. HERBERT
ExecutiveDirector

Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GREGORY S. BELL JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Governor Division Director

May 12, 2011

QEP Energy Company
11002 E 17500 S
Vernal, UT 84078

Subject: RW 23-26B Well, 1979' FSL, 1979' FWL, NE SW, Sec. 26, T. 7 South, R. 23 East,
Uintah County, Utah

Ladies and Gentlemen:

Pursuant to Utah Code Ann.§40-6-1 et seq., and Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et
seq., the Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining issues conditions of approval, and permit to drill
the listed well. This permit is issued in accordance with the requirements of Cause: 187-07. The
expected producing formation or pool is the Mesaverde Formation(s), completion into any other
zones will require filing a Sundry Notice (Form 9). Completion and commingling of more than
one pool will require approval in accordance with R649-3-22.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date.
The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-15290.

Sincerely,

John Rogers
Associate Director

m/js
Enclosures

cc: Uintah County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal Office

UTAH

DNR

1594West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City,UT 84114 -5801

telephone (80 l) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • wwmogm.utah gOV OIL, GAS &



Operator: QEP Energy Company
Well Name & Number RW 23-26B

API Number: 43-04715290
Lease: UTU-0566

Location: NE SW Sec. ] T. 7 South R. 23 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following
actions during drilling of this well:
• Within 24 hours following the spudding of the well - contact Carol Daniels at 801-

538-5284 (please let a voicemail message if not available)
OR
Submit an electronic sundry notice (pre-registration required) via the Utah Oil & Gas
website at http://oileas.ogm.utah.gov

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dustin Doucet at (801) 538-5281 office

(801) 733-0983 after office hours

3. Reporting Requirements
All reports, forms and submittals as required by the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation
General Rules will be promptly filed with the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, including
but not limited:
• Entity Action Form (Form 6) - due within 5 days of spudding the well
• Monthly Status Report (Form 9) - due by 5thday of the following calendar month
• Requests to Change Plans (Form 9) - due prior to implementation
• Written Notice of Emergency Changes (Form 9) -- due within 5 days
• Notice of Operations Suspension or Resumption (Form 9) - due prior to implementation
• Report of Water Encountered (Form 7) - due within 30 days after completion
• Well Completion Report (Form 8) - due within 30 days after completion or plugging

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to





Unit # Lease# API number Well name Well # QTR SEC TWP RGE Future Plans for well bore
8910084820 UTUO807 4304731873 WV 121 NWSW 14 8S 21E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO81 4304715296 RW 12-148 SWNW 14 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO2030 4304715272 RW 12-208 SWNW 20 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO566 4304730311 RW 12-26B SWNW 26 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO933 4304730199 RW 13-27B NWSW 27 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO116 4304715258 RW 21-18B NENW 18 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO81 4304715186 RW 21-228 NENW 22 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO82 4304715167 RW 21-24B NENW 24 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO566 4304715191 RW 21-27B NENW 27 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO567 4304733522 RW 22-21B SENW 21 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO81 4304715153 RW 23-22B NESW 22 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO566 4304715290 RW 23-26B NESW 26 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO2030 4304715283 RW 31-28B NWNE 28 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO566 4304715275 RW 32-268 SWNE 26 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO558 4304715230 RW 32-28A SWNE 28 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO81 4304715152 RW 34-148 SWSE 14 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO82 4304731576 RW 42-23B SENE 23 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO82 4304715295 RW 43-24B NESE 24 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO566 4304730259 RW 43-26B NESE 26 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO2030 4304716475 RW 43-28B NESE 28 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO566 4304731053 RW 44-27B SESE 27 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO81 4304716495 RW 41-158 NENE 15 7S 23E Working on permits to deepen to MV in 2012
8920007610 UTUO2148 4304730309 RW 14-18C SWSW 18 7S 24E Working on permits to deepen to MV in



RECEIVED: Jan. 09, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-0566 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 RED WASH 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 RW 23-26B 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047152900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 RED WASH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1979 FSL 1979 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 26 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

1 /5 /2012

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 DRILLING ON THIS WELL COMMENCED: 01/05/2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Valyn Davis 435 781-4369

TITLE
 Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 1 /9 /2012

January 09, 2012

Tax Credit Number: 21872 API Well Number: 43047152900000Tax Credit Number: 21872 API Well Number: 43047152900000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING U-0566

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. RED WASH

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well RW 23-26B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047152900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext RED WASH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

1979 FSL 1979 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESW Section: 26 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

1/ 5/2 0 12 REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

DRILLING ON THIS WELL COMMENCED: 01/05/2012 Accepted by the
utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
January 09, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Valyn Davis 435 781-4369 Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 1/9/2012

RECEIVED: Jan. 09,



RECEIVED: Feb. 01, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-0566 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 RED WASH 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 RW 23-26B 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047152900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 RED WASH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1979 FSL 1979 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 26 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

1 /31 /2012

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 THIS WELL COMMENCED PRODUCTION ON: 01/31/2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Valyn Davis 435 781-4369

TITLE
 Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 2 /1 /2012

February 01, 2012

Sundry Number: 22630 API Well Number: 43047152900000Sundry Number: 22630 API Well Number: 43047152900000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING U-0566

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. RED WASH

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well RW 23-26B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047152900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext RED WASH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

1979 FSL 1979 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESW Section: 26 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

1/3 1/2 0 12
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

THIS WELL COMMENCED PRODUCTION ON: 01/31/2012 Accepted by the
utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
February 01, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Valyn Davis 435 781-4369 Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 2/1/2012

RECEIVED: Feb. 01,



STATE OF UTAH FORM6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

OlVISION OF OIL,GAS AND MINING

ENTITYACTION FORM

Operator: QEP ENERGYCOMPANY Operator Account Number: N 3700

Address: 11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH

city VERNAL

state UT zip 84078 Phone Number: (435) 781-4369

Well 1
API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
4304715290 RW23-26B NESW 26 7S 23E UINTAH

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

E 5670 1/5/2012
Comments

GRRV TO MVRD

wellAPI
Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

WeilAPI
Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

ACTION CODES:
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) ValynDavis
B - Add new well toexisting entity (groupor unit well) lease Prin
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity Signature
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) Regulatory Affairs Analyst 1/18/2012

RECE1VED vita. o.t.
terroco'

JAN1 8 2012

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&



RECEIVED: Feb. 15, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-0566 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 RED WASH 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 RW 23-26B 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047152900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 RED WASH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1979 FSL 1979 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 26 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

2 /15 /2012

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  CONFIDENTIAL

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 QEP ENERGY COMPANY REQUESTS THIS WELL BE FILED AS
"CONFIDENTIAL". 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Valyn Davis 435 781-4369

TITLE
 Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 2 /15 /2012

February 21, 2012

Sundry Number: 23111 API Well Number: 43047152900000Sundry Number: 23111 API Well Number: 43047152900000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING U-0566

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. RED WASH

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well RW 23-26B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047152900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext RED WASH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

1979 FSL 1979 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESW Section: 26 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

2/15/2012
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: CONFIDENTIAL

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP ENERGYCOMPANYREQUESTS THIS WELLBE FILEDAS Accepted by the
"CONFIDENTIAL". Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
February 21, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Valyn Davis 435 781-4369 Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 2/15/2012

RECEIVED: Feb. 15,



RECEIVED
ST E FEB27 2012 AMENDED REPORT O FORM 8

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES (highlight changes)
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINIJOFOlL,GAS&MINING 5. LEASEDES1GNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTU-0566

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

ia. TYPE OF WELL: O
LL

SLL DRY 0THER 7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

E'L
HOR EP-

TRY
EFSFŸR.

OTHER RW 23-26B
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

QEP Energy Company 4304715290
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
1050 17th Street Ste 500 cirv Denver STATE CO ZiP 80265 (303) 672-6900 Red Wash

4. LOCATIONOF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,
MERIDIANATSURFACE: 1979' FSL; 1979' FWL

NESW 26 7S 23E
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVALREPORTED BELOW: STRO

12.COUNTY 13.STATEAT TOTALDEPTH: $2 Uintah UTAH
14. DATE SPUDDED: 15. DATET.D. REACHED: 16. DATE COMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL):

1/5/2012 1/13/2012 1/31/2012 ABANDONED READYTO PRODUCE 2 5521' KB
18. TOTAL DEPTH: MD 19. PLUG BACKT.D.: MD 20. IF MULTIPLECOMPLETlONS, HOW MANY7* 21. DEPTH BRlDGE MD

PLUG SET:
TVD j Û 73 TVD TVD

22. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICALLOGS RUN (Submit copy of each) 23.

WAS WELL CORED? NO YES (Submit analysis)Quad Combo
WAS DST RUN? NO YES (Submit report)
DIRECTIONALSURVEY7 NO YES (Submit copy)

24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in well)

HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE WEIGHT (#lft.) TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) STAGE PEMHENTER CNEMET TACKES VOLSWMRE
BL) CEMENT TOP ** AMOUNT PULLED

61/8" 41/2" HCIb 11.6 0 10,915 dassg SGS 259 5490 CBL

25. TUBING RECORD

DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD

FORMATIONNAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM (TVD) INTERVAL(ToplBot - MD) SIZE NO. HOLES PERFORATION STATUS

(A) IVieSSVerde 8,328 10,575 9,936 101378 .35 144 open Squeezed

(B) Open Squeezed

(C) Open Squeezed

(D) Open Squeezed

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTFRVAL AMOUNTANDTYPE OF MATERIAL

10,324'- 10,378' 19.2 bbl 15% HCI, 2269 bbl fresh water, 449 sks 30/50 sand
10,248'- 10,274' 19.2 bbl 15% HCI,5385 bbl fresh water, 1,322 sks 30/50 sand
9,936'- 10,028' 19.2 bbl 15% HCI, 2442 bbl fresh water, 452 sks 30/50 sand
29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

ELECTRICAL/MECHANICALLOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONALSURVEY Producing
SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGING AND CEMENT VERIFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER: lŠE ing Report

(5/2000) (CONTINUED ON



31. INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVALA (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:

1/31/2012 2/6/2012 24 RATES: -> 13 1,128 265 Flowing
CHOKE SI2E: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:

18/64 1,060 RATES: -> 13 1,128 265
INTERVALB (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: -*

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS, PI GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: 1NTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

INTERVALC (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: -

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU-GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCT10N OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: ->

INTERVALD (As shown In item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED . TEST PRÖDUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATFR - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: ->

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GASIOIL RATlO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: ->

32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

33. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES (include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION (Log) MARKERS:

Show allimportant zones of porosity and contentsthereof:Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushionused, timetoolopen, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Fomiation Dp) Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (MeasumdpDepth)

Green River 2,671
Mahogany 3,440
Wasatch 5,984
Mesaverde 8,328
Sego 10,575

35. ADDITIONALREMARKf (Include plugg ig procedure)

36. I hereby certifythat the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records.

NAME(PLEASE PRlNT) Morgan Anderson TITLE Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE 2/23/2012

This report must be submitted within 30 days of
• completing or plugging a new well • reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
e drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore • significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
• recompleting to a different producing formation e drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from twoor more formations.

** ITEM24: Cement Top -Showhowreported top(s)of cement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL),cement bond log (CBL),temperaturesurvey (TS))

Send to: Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801



QEP ENERGY Page 1 of 5

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RWU 23-26B (184) Spud Date: 12/31/1962
Location: 26- 7-S 23-E 27 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

1/1/2012 18:00 - 06:00 12.00 LOC 4 CUT DRLG LINE, RIG DOWN TOP DRIVE, DRAIN UP AND BLOW OUT LINES,
GNERAL RIG DOWN.

1/2/2012 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 LOC 3 REMOVE #2 ENGINE AND TRANSMISSION, MOVE CAMPS, MOVE TD POWER
UNIT,TUBULARS, CHOKE MANIFOLD, MUD PIT, CAT WALK, PIPE TUBS, ETC.

18:00 -06:00 12.00 LOC 4 INSTALL#2 ENGINE AND TRANSMISSION. THE WRONG FLYWHEEL BOLTS
WERE SENT WITH THE REPLACEMENT ENGINE. CORRECT BOLTS ARE
EXPECTED TO BE HERE ON 01/02/12 - AM.

1/3/2012 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 LOC 3 LOWER DERRICK ONTO CARRIER FOR MOVE. SPOT SUB OVER HOLE. SPOT
CARRIER ONTO RAILS AND RAISE DERRICK. SET BACK YARDAND PIPE
TUBS. RELEASE WESTROC TRUCKING @ 17:30.

18:00 -06:00 12.00 LOC 4 RUN AND TIGHTEN GUIDE WIRES, INSTALLTOPDRIVE RAILAND TOPDRIVE,
RIG UP FLOOR, RUN ELETRICAL, PASON, WATERAND STEAM LINES,

1/4/2012 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 LOC 4 CHANGE OUT SPACER SPOOL,NIPPLE UP BOPE. SET CENTRIFUGE AND
PLUMB IN, SET GAS BUSTER AND PLUMB IN. RIG UP SUPER CHOKE. RIG UP
FLARE LINES AND FLARE STACK. DIG RIG DITCHES. REMOVE SECTION OF
STANDPIPE AND CHANGE OUTLETSTO WELDED 2" 1502 FITTINGS.

18:00 - 06:00 12.00 LOC 4 RIG UP MUD TANKS, CIRCULATE STEAM AND WATER, FINISH RIGGING UP
TONGS AND PIPE SPINNERS, FUNCTION TEST BOP. LAYOUTAND STRAP
BHA
(EMAILED NOTIFIED BLMAND LEFT MESSAGE FOR THE STATE ON UP
COMING PRESSURE TEST AND DRILLOUT).

1/5/2012 06:00 -09:30 3,50 LOC 4 FILL MUD PIT, GET WATER CIRCULATING. FINISH LINING UP BHA.
09:30 - 11:00 1,50 BOP 1 PJSM WITH B&C QUICK TEST.TORQUE BOP BOLTS ON 3 - BREAKS.
11:00 - 15:30 4.50 BOP 2 TEST BOPE WITH B&C QUICK TEST. TEST LOWER KELLYVALVE,SAFETY

VALVE,DART VALVE,PIPE RAMS & INSIDE VALVES, HCR AND OUTSIDE KILL
LINE VALVE,CHOKE LINE, GUAGE VALVEAND INSIDE MANIFOLD VALVES,
BLIND RAMS, AND OUTSIDE MANIFOLD VALVES TO 250 PSI FOR 5 MINUTES,
AND 5,000 PSI FOR 10 MINUTES. TESTANNULAR TO 2500 PSI FOR 10
MINUTES AND 250 PSI FOR 5 MINUTES.

15:30 - 17:30 2.00 TRP 1 MAKE UP BIT #1 TO 5" HUNTING 7/8 2.6 STG. 0.26 RPG 1.5 DEG FIXED BEND
MOTOR #052. SCRIBE UP TO NATIVE NAVIGATIONEMMWD GAMMATOOL.
PICK UP ISENHOUR REAMER - 6.125" PASS THROUGH AND OPENS HOLE TO
6.50"

17:30 - 18:30 1.00 OTH INSTALL NEW STAND PIPE MANIFOLDWITH FABRICATED WELD IN FITTINGS
AND WELD IN 1502 HAMMER UNIONS

18:30 - 21:30 3.00 TRP 2 HELD SAFETY MEETING RIG UP LAYDOWNTRUCK AND PICK UP 3 1/2" DRILL
STRING

21:30 - 22:30 1.00 DRL 5 TAG UP AND DRILL COMPOSITE BRIDGE PLUG a 1,019'
22:30 - 02:00 3.50 TRP 2 CONTINUE PICKING UP DRILL STRING TO 3,966'
02:00 - 03:00 1.00 OTH STRAP PIPE AND ENTER IN PIPE TALLY
03:00 - 04:30 1.50 TRP 2 CONTINUE PICKING UP 3 1/2" DRILL STRING
04:30 - 05:30 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP AND RIG DOWN LAYDOWNTRUCK
05:30 -06:00 0.50 SUR 1 HELD PJSA, AND RIG UP AND RUN WIRELINE GYRO WITH NATIVE

NAVIGATION
1/6/2012 06:00 - 08:00 2.00 SUR 1 RUN NATIVENAVIGATIONGYRO SURVEY FROM 25' TO 5541'

08:00 - 08:30 0.50 REAM 1 WASH 40' TO BOTTOM AND BREAK IN BIT
08:30 - 11:30 3.00 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 5534' TO 5634' @33.3 FPH. RUN HUNTING 7/8 2.6

0.26 RPG 1.5 DEG FBH MOTOR. 280 GPM, 150 -250 DIFFERENTIAL, 15 RPM
ROTARY, 73 MOTORRPM, 10-12 WOB.

11:30 - 12:00 0.50 OTH DRAIN STACK, FILL CHOKE LINEAND MANIFOLD WITH METHANOL.
12:00 - 16:00 4.00 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 5634' TO 5776' @ 35.5 FPH. RUN HUNTING 7/8 2.6

0.26 RPG 1.5 DEG FBH MOTOR. 300 GPM, 150 -250 DIFFERENTIAL, 15 -45

RPM ROTARY, 78 MOTOR RPM, 10-12 WOB.

Printed 2/10/2012 2:28:44



QEP ENERGY Page 2 of 5

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RWU 23-26B (184) Spud Date: 12/31/1962Location: 26- 7-S 23-E 27 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

SubDate From - To Hours Code Code Description of Operations
1/6/2012 16:00 - 16:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE

16:30 -05:00 12.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 5776' TO 6300' @42 FPH. RUN HUNTING 7/8 2.6
0.26 RPG 1.5 DEG FBH MOTOR. 300 GPM, 150 -250 DIFFERENTIAL, 15 -45

RPM ROTARY, 78 MOTOR RPM, 10-12 WOB.
05:00 -06:00 1.00. SUR 1 CONNECTJONSAND SURVEYS

1/7/2012 06:00 - 15:00 9.00 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 6300' TO 6606' @34 FPH. RUN HUNTING 7/8 2.6
0.26 RPG 1.5 DEG FBH MOTOR. 275 GPM, 150 -300 DIFFERENTIAL, 45 RPM
ROTARY, 72 MOTOR RPM, 10-12 WOB.

15:00 - 15:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIGSERVICE & BOP DRILL
15:30 - 17:00 1.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 6606' TO 6680' @49 FPH. RUN HUNTING 7/8 2.6

0.26 RPG 1.5 DEG FBH MOTOR. 275 GPM, 150 -300 DIFFERENTIAL, 45 RPM
ROTARY, 72 MOTOR RPM, 10-13 WOB.

17:00 - 18:00 1.00 SUR 1 SURVEYS & CONNECTIONS
18:00 -05:00 11.00 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 6680' to 7307' @ 57 FPH. RUN HUNTING 7/8 2.6

0.26 RPG 1.5 DEG FBH MOTOR.275 GPM, 150 -300 DIFFERENTIAL, 35-45
RPM ROTARY, 72 MOTORRPM, 10-13 WOB.

05:00 -06:00 1.00 SUR 1 CONNECTIONS AND SURVEYS
1/8/2012 06:00 -06:30 0.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 730T to 7347' @ 80 FPH. RUN HUNTING 7/8 2.6

0.26 RPG 1.5 DEG FBH MOTOR. 275 GPM, 150 -300 DIFFERENTIAL, 35-45
RPM ROTARY, 72 MOTORRPM, 10-13 WOB.

06:30 -07:30 1.00 RIG 2 WORK ON PUMPS, REPLACE CAP GASKET ON #1, REPLACE VALVESEATS
ON #2

07:30 - 12:30 5.00 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 734T to 7559' @42.4 FPH. RUN HUNTING 7/8 2.6
0.26 RPG 1.5 DEG FBH MOTOR. 275 GPM, 150 -300 DIFFERENTIAL, 35-45
RPM ROTARY, 72 MOTORRPM, 10-13 WOB.

12:30 - 13:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
13:00 - 16:30 3.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 7559' TO 7814' @72 FPH. RUN HUNTING 7/8 2.6

0.26 RPG 1.5 DEG FBH MOTOR. 275 GPM, 150 -300 DIFFERENTIAL, 35-45
RPM ROTARY, 72 MOTORRPM, 10-13 WOB.

16:30 - 17:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE - CHANGE BALLVALVEON MUD LINE17:00-18:00 1.00 SUR 1 SURVEYSANDCONNECTIONS
| 18:00 -05:00 11.00 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 7814' to 8390 @ 52 FPH. RUN HUNTING 7/8 2.6

0.26 RPG 1.5 DEG FBH MOTOR. 275 GPM, 150 -300 DIFFERENTIAL, 35-45
RPM ROTARY, 72 MOTORRPM, 12-14 WOB.

05:00 -06:00 1.00 SUR 1 CONNECTIONS AND SURVEYS
1/9/2012 06:00 - 15:00 9.00 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 8390' TO 8773 @42.5 FPH. RUN HUNTING 7/8 2.6

0.26 RPG 1.5 DEG FBH MOTOR. 275 GPM, 150 -300 DIFFERENTIAL, 35-45
RPM ROTARY, 72 MOTORRPM, 12-14 WOB.

15:00 - 15:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
15:30 - 17:00 1.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 8773' TO 8870 @65 FPH. RUN HUNTING 7/8 2.6

0.26 RPG 1.5 DEG FBH MOTOR. 275 GPM, 150 -300 DIFFERENTIAL, 35-45
RPM ROTARY, 72 MOTORRPM, 12-14 WOB.

17:00 - 18:00 1.00 SUR 1 SURVEYS AND CONNECTIONS
18:00 - 05:00 11.00 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 8870' TO 9500' @57 FPH. RUN HUNTING 7/8 2.6

0.26 RPG 1.5 DEG FBH MOTOR. 275 GPM, 150 -300 DIFFERENTIAL, 35-45
RPM ROTARY,72 MOTORRPM, 12-14 WOB.

05:00 -06:00 1.00 SUR 1 CONNECTIONSAND SURVEYS
1/10/2012 06:00 - 06:30 0.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 9500' TO 9525' @50 FPH. RUN HUNTING7/8 2.6

0.26 RPG 1.5 DEG FBH MOTOR. 275 GPM, 150 -300 DIFFERENTIAL, 35-45
RPM ROTARY, 72 MOTORRPM, 12-14 WOB.

06:30 - 07:00 0.50 CIRC 2 LOST 25 BBL MUD @9525', 10PPG MUD WEIGHT - MIX LCMAND REGAIN
FULL CIRCULATION.

07:00 -09:30 2.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 9525' TO 9602' @ 30.8 FPH. RUN HUNTING 7/8 2.6

| |
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QEP ENERGY Page 3 of 5

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RWU 23-26B (184) Spud Date: 12/31/1962
Location: 26- 7-S 23-E 27 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

1/10/2012 07:00 - 09:30 2.50 DRL 2 0.26 RPG 1.5 DEG FBH MOTOR. 250 GPM, 150 -300 DIFFERENTIAL, 35-45
RPM ROTARY,65 MOTOR RPM, 12-14 WOB.

09:30 - 10:30 1.00 OTH CHANGE ROTATING HEAD RUBBER. DOWN LINKTO EMMWD TOOL IN
ORDER TO INCREASE SIGNAL STRENGTH.

10:30 - 16:30 6.00 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 9602' TO 9836' @39 FPH. RUN HUNTING 7/8 2.6
0.26 RPG 1.5 DEG FBH MOTOR. 250 GPM, 150 -300 DIFFERENTIAL, 35-45
RPM ROTARY,65 MOTOR RPM, 12-14 WOB.

16:30 - 17:00 0.50 RIG 1 ROUTINE RIG SERVICE, GREASE TOPDRIVE, SWIVEL, AND BLOCKS
17:00 - 18:00 1.00 SUR 1 CONNECTIONS AND SURVEYS
18:00 - 19:30 1.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 9836' TO 9934' @65 FPH. RUN HUNTING 7/8 2.6

0.26 RPG 1.5 DEG FBH MOTOR. 250 GPM, 150 -300 DIFFERENTIAL, 35-45
RPM ROTARY, 65 MOTOR RPM, 12-14 WOB.

19:30 - 21:30 2.00 CIRC 2 LOSS PARTIAL RETURNS, PICK OFF BOTTOM SLOW PUMPS AND MIX LCM
MATERIALTO REGAIN RETURNS, BYPASS SHAKERS TO KEEP LCM IN
SYSTEM, ( LOSS OF 130 BLS)

21:30 -06:00 8.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 9934' TO 10169 @27 FPH. RUN HUNTING 7/8 2.6
0.26 RPG 1.5 DEG FBH MOTOR. 250 GPM, 150 -300 DIFFERENTIAL, 35-45
RPM ROTARY,65 MOTOR RPM, 12-14 WOB.

1/11/2012 06:00 -08:30 2.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION MUDTO 10.3 PPG. MIXING PUMP BROKE
DOWN CAUSING LIGHT SPOTS AND HEAVYSPOTS IN MUD.

08:30 - 09:00 0.50 CIRC 1 FLOW CHECK FOR 20 MINUTES, FLOW WAS DECREASING SLOWLY -

BALLOONING FROM LOST CIRCULATION. PUMP DRY PILL.
09:00 - 10:30 1.50 TRP 13 TRIP OUT FOR MWD FAILURE. TRIP OUT TO 8380'. - SLM
10:30 - 12:00 1.50 RIG 6 DRILLING LINE BECAME FOULED ON DRAW WORKS DRUM. HANG OFF

BLOCKS AND CUT DRILLING LINE.CIRCULATE WELL @128 GPM.
12:00 - 18:00 6.00 TRP 13 TRIP OUT OF HOLE - SLM.
18:00 - 21:30 3.50 DRL 3 LAYDOWN REAMER, BREAK BIT MOTOR, MAKE UP NEW BITAND MOTOR,

CHANGE BATTERIES AND ORIENT MWD TOOL
21:30 -04:30 7.00 ITRP 13 TRIP IN HOLE FILLING PIPE AND BREAKING CIRCULATION EVERY 20

STANDS
CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP @5560' AND 8700'

04:30 -06:00 1.50 TRP 13 TRIP OUT 10 STANDSTO TURN UP MWD TOOLS POWER SETTING, FAILURE
TO COMMUNICATE

1/12/2012 06:00 - 09:30 3.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE TROUBLE SHOOT MWD, RAN NEW TRANSDUCER AND
COMMUNICATION WIRE, STILL FAILED TO COMMUNICATE WITH TOOL

09:30 - 10:30 1.00 TRP 13 TRIP OUT 5 STANDS, STILL NO COMMUNICATION, TRIP IN
10:30 - 11:30 1.00 REAM 1 WASH REAM 90' TO BOTTOM
11:30 - 18:00 6.50 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 10169' TO 10396' @34.9 FPH.STKS #1& #2

PUMPS 0/95 185 GPMPSI ON & OFF BOTTOM 1802/1651 PSI, MOTOR RPM &
ROTARY RPM 48/45 TOTAL 93,TORQUE ON &OFF BOTTOM 2020/1529,
PUISO/ROT 175/130/153, WT ON BIT 14/18, HUNTING MOTOR 1.5 BEND,.26
RPG, 7/8 LOBE, 2.6 STAGE, LOST 75 TO 85 BBLS, 5% LCM IN SYSTEM,
REMOVED SHAKER SCREEN

18:00 - 06:00 12.00 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 10396' TO 10834' @ 36.5 FPH WITH HUNTING 7/8
LOBE, 2.6 STAGE, 0.26 RPG, 1.5° FBH MOTOR. 185 GPM, 1800 PSI, 150 - 300
DIFF, 35 ROTARY RPM, 48 MOTOR RPM, 14/18 WOB.

1/13/2012 06:00 - 09:00 3.00 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 10834' TO 10920' @ 28.6 FPH.STKS #1& #2
PUMPS 100/0 185 GPMPSI ON & OFF BOTTOM 1750/1590 PSI, MOTOR RPM &
ROTARY RPM 48/45 TOTAL 93,TORQUE ON &OFF BOTTOM 2020/1529,
PUISO/ROT 175/130/153, WT ON BIT 14/18, HUNTING MOTOR 1.5 BEND,.26
RPG, 7/8 LOBE, 2.6 STAGE

09:00 - 10:30 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE CONDITION, WT UP TO 11.0
10:30 - 11:30 1.00 TRP 14 WIPER TRIP 19 STANDS TO 9728'
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RWU 23-26B (184) Spud Date: 12/31/1962
Location: 26- 7-S 23-E 27 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

1/13/2012 11:30 - 12:30 1.00 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, WORK ON DRAW WORKS ENGINE WATER LEAK
12:30 - 14:00 1.50 TRP 14 WIPER TRIP OUT TO 8900' NO TIGHT SPOTS

TRIP IN HOLE TO BOTTOM
14:00 - 01:30 11.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION, GAINED 15 BBLS CLEAR WATER ON BOTTOMS

UP WITH A .6 CUT - 11.0 IN 10.4 OUT. RAISE MUD WT TO KILLWATERFLOW.
LOST RETURNS WITH 11.2 IN THE ANNULUS, REDUCE PUMP RATE, MIXLCM
AND ESTABLISH RETURNS WITH 10.9 MUD WT IN 10.1 OUT WITH 4000 +/-

UNITS OF BACKGROUIND GAS. RAISE MUD WT BACK TO 11.1 PPG WITH 5 -

7% LCM INTHE SYSTEM FULL RETURNS WITH 10.3 OUT
01:30 - 04:30 3.00 CIRC 1 BUILDAND ATTEMPT TO PUMP ECD PILL. PILL TANK SUCTION PLUGGED.

BACK FLUSH AND FINISH PUMPING AND SPOTTING ECD PILL ON BOTTOM
04:30 - 06:00 1.50 RIG 2 DRILLER BACKED OUT OF JOINT TO PULL PIPE AND PULLED THE GRABBER

ASSEMBLY OFF THE TOP DRIVE 30' UP. SECURE GRABBER,BREAK OFF
SINGLE AND MOUSEHOLE. WORK ON REMOVING GRABBER AND PLUGGING
HYDROLIC HOSES.

1/14/2012 06:00 -09:00 3.00 TRP 15 TRIP OUT TO 10197, ESTABLISH CIRCULATION & FULL RETURNS MUD 11.0 IN
10.4 OUT, GAS 7188 UNITS WHILE VENTING, STAGE IN HOLE 3 STANDS
ESTABLISH CIRCULATION FULL RETURNS MUD 11.0 IN 10,4 OUT, STAGE 5
STANDS IN HOLE FULL RETURNS MUD 11+ IN 10.5 OUT 10% LCM IN 5% OUT

09:00 - 17:00 8.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE CONDITION, WEIGHT UP TO KILLWATER INFLUX,ADDING LCM
TO MAINTAINLOSSES, FLOW CHECK WITH 11.3 IN 11.2 OUT WELL FLOWING
A LITTLE, BUILDAND PUMP ECD PILL, SPACE DRY PILL WHILE PUMPING

17:00 - 21:00 4.00 TRP 2 TRIP OUT TO SHOE FOR LOGS, MONITORING WELL AND FLOW CHECK
PERIODICALLY

21:00 - 22:30 1.50 OTH FLOW CHECK AND BUILDTRIP SLUG, WELL FLOWING @ 1.5 BBLS/HR, PUMP
40 BBL SLUG @ 3# OVER.

22:30 -03:30 5.00 TRP 2 TRIP OUT FOR LOGS, MONITOR WELLAND FLOW CHECK
03:30 - 06:00 2.50 LOG 1 PJSM, RIG UP AND RUN HES TRIPLE COMBO

1/15/2012 06:00 - 11:00 5.00 LOG 1 RUN TRIPLE COMBO LOG, HITA BRIDGE @ LOG DEPTH OF 10,585, HOLE
DEPTH 10,920, RIG DOWN LOGGERS

11:00 - 12:00 1.00 RIG 1 DAILYRIG SERVICE
12:00 - 16:30 4.50 TRP 15 PICK UP DIRECTIONAL BHATRIP IN HOLE TO 2500' TO LOGSEGO TOP WITH

GAMMATOOL. STAGE IN THE HOLE TO DISPLACE OUT HEAVY MUD.
16:30 - 17:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE OUT HEAVYMUD @ 4.5 BBLSIMIN, 100% RETURNS, 11.2 IN - 11.4

OUT, TREAT 11.4 BACK TO 11.2 WHILE TRIPPING INTO SHOE
17:00 - 18:00 1.00 TRP 2 TRIP INTO THE SHOE
18:00 - 19:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE OUT HEAVYMUD @4.5 BBL/MIN, 100% RETURNS, 11.2 IN / 11.2

OUT - 20% LCM
19:00 - 21:00 2.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN TO 9500
21:00 - 22:30 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE OUT HEAVYMUD @ 3 BBL/MIN, 70% RETURNS, LOST 80 BBLS

11.2 IN / 11.2 OUT - 20 % LCM
22:30 - 06:00 7.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN THE HOLE TO 10100, CIRCULATE 3500 STKS TO MOVE TOP 500' OF

ECD PILL UP THE HOLE AND LOG GAMMATO 10550 @ 150'lHR
1/16/2012 06:00 - 10:00 4.00 REAM 1 LOG GAMMAFROM 10,550 TO 10,920 TAG BRIDGE @10,601 TOOK 7K TO

REAM THRU TO 10,615
10:00 - 14:30 4.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE CONDITION HOLE TO LAYDOWN DRILL STRING, BUILD & PUMP

ECD PILLAND DRY JOB - PJSM AND RIG UP LAYDOWN TRUCK WHILE
CIRCULATING

14:30 - 18:30 4.00 TRP 2 LAYDOWN DRILL PIPE TO SHOE, CHECKING FLOW PERIODICALLY
18:30 - 19:30 1.00 CIRC 1 PUMP 14 PPG SLUG AT SHOE, HAD TO BACK FLUSH PUMP INTO PILL TANK

TO CLEAR OUT LCMAND ESTABLISH SUCTION
19:30 -23:30 4.00 TRP 2 LAYDOWN DRILL PIPE, BHAAND DIRECTIONAL TOOLS
23:30 -01:00 1.50 CSG 1 PJSM, RIG UP WEATHERFORD CASING CREW
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RWU 23-26B (184) Spud Date: 12/31/1962
Location: 26- 7-S 23-E 27 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

1/16/2012 01:00 - 01:30 0.50 CSG 2 MAKE UP SHOE TRACK AND 5 JOINTS, ATTEMPT TO FILLAND CIRC
THROUGH FLOAT EQUIP, CANT GET MUD TO RIG FLOOR

01:30 -03:30 2.00 OTH BACK FLUSH PUMP SUCTIONS AND GOT MUD TO RIG FLOOR BUT CANT
GET THE PUMPS TO MOVE MUD, GO THROUGH #1 PUMP AND FIND VALVES
BACKED OFF WITH LCM,ALSO CLEAN OUTSUCTION AND SUCTION LINE.

03:30 -06:00 2.50 CSG 2 RUN 4.5 PRODUCTION CASING
1/17/2012 06:00 - 09:30 3.50 CSG 2 RUN 4.5 CASING, FILLAND DISPLACE PIPE EVERY 1000', TO SHOE

09:30 - 11:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP @SHOE TO DISPLACE AND TREAT ECD PILL
11:00 - 12:00 1.00 CSG 2 RUN 4.5 CASING TO 7258
12:00 - 13:30 1.50 OTH WORK ON PUMPS, SUCTIONS ON BOTH PUMPS PACKED OFF AND THE

BOTTOM OF THE MODUALE, HOOK UP HALLIBURTONTO MUD SYSTEM AND
CIRCULATE CASING

13:30 - 17:00 3.50 CSG 2 RUN 4.5 CASING BREAK CIRCULATION AT 8850', 9759' AND AT TD 10,915
17:00 - 19:00 2.00 CIRC 1 ClRCULATE BOTTOMS UP GAS, RIG DOWN WEATHERFORD CASING CREW

SPOT HALLIBURTONTRUCKS MAX GAS 2200
19:00 - 23:00 4.00 CMT 2 PJSM, SWAP TO HALLIBURTON. PUMP 10 BBL WATER, PRESSURE TEST

LINES TO 5,000 PSI. PUMP 40 BBL SUPER FLUSH MIXEDAT 10 LBIGAL, PUMP
10 BBL WATER. PUMP 405 SKS (212 BBL) EXTENDACEM LEAD CEMENT
MIXEDAT 11 LB/GAL, 2.95 FT3/SK YIELD, 17.68 GAL/SK WATER. PUMP 160
SKS (48BBL) EXPANDACEM TAILCEMENT, MIXEDAT 13 LB/GAL, 1.65 FT3/SK
YlELD, 8.91 GALISK WATER. ALL SLURRY PUMPED AT 6 BPM. DROP LOCK
DOWN PLUG. DISPLACE WITH 169 BBL 2% KCL WATER (169 BBL
CALCULATED). DISPLACED 140 BBLAT 5 BPM, 7 BBLAT 7 BPM. 17 BBLAT 3
GOOD RETURNS THROUGHOUT JOB. FINALCIRCULATING PRESSURE WAS
2245 PSI @3 BPM, BUMPED PLUGWITH 3624 PSI. HELD PRESSURE FOR 5
MINUTES. FLOATS HELD WITH 2.25 BBL BACK. 19 BBLS CEMENT RETURNED
TO SURFACE, FLUSH STACK AND FLOW LINE WITH SUGAR WATER, RIG
DOWN HALLIBURTON

23:00 - 02:00 3.00 BOP 1 NIPPLE DOWN TO SET SLIPS
02:00 - 03:00 1.00 CSG 7 SET SLIPS WITH 100K (10 K OVER) AND CUT OFF CASING
03:00 - 04:00 1.00 BOP 1 FINISH NIPPLING DOWN BOPE
04:00 - 06:00 | 2.00 OTH CLEAN MUD TANKS

1/18/2012 06:00 - 12:00 6.00 OTH CLEAN MUD TANKS, RELEASE RIG @ 12:00
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RECEIVED: May. 16, 2012

                           FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-0566 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 RED WASH 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 RW 23-26B 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047152900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 RED WASH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1979 FSL 1979 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 26 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

5 /16 /2012

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 QEP ENERGY COMPANY WOULD LIKE TO OPTIMIZE THE BOTTOM HOLE
SPACING OF THE MESA VERDE DEVELOPMENT, THEREFORE, QEP ENERGY

COMPANY WOULD LIKE TO DRILL THIS WELL DIRECTIONALLY. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Jan Nelson 435 781-4331

TITLE
 Permit Agent

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 5 /16 /2012

May 21, 2012

Sundry Number: 25810 API Well Number: 43047152900000Sundry Number: 25810 API Well Number: 43047152900000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING U-0566

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. RED WASH

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well RW 23-26B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047152900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext RED WASH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

1979 FSL 1979 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESW Section: 26 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

5/16/2012
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP ENERGY COMPANY WOULD LIKETO OPTIMlZE THE BOTTOM HOLE Approved by the
SPACING OF THE MESAVERDE DEVELOPMENT,THEREFORE, QEP ENERGY Utah Division of

COMPANY WOULD LIKETO DRILLTHIS WELL DIRECTIONALLY. Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: May 21, 2012

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jan Nelson 435 781-4331 Permit Agent

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/16/2012

RECEIVED: May. 16,



RECEIVED: May. 18, 2012
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RECEIVED: May. 16, 2012

Sundry Number: 25810 API Well Number: 43047152900000Sundry Number: 25810 API Well Number: 43047152900000

11002 East 17500 South
Vernal, UT 84078
Telephone 435-781-4331
Fax 435-781-4395

QEP Energy Company
May 16, 2012

Ms. Diana Mason
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-6100

RE: Directional Drilling R649-3-11
Red Wash Unit
RW 23-26B
1979' FSL 1979' FWL, NESW, Section 26, T7S, R23E (Surface)
1741' FSL 1722' FWL, NESW, Section 26, T7S, R23E (Bottom Hole)
Uintah County, Utah

Dear Ms. Mason:

Pursuant to the filing of QEP Energy Company Application for Permit to Drillregarding the
above referenced well,we are hereby submitting this letter in accordance with Oil & Gas
Conservation Rule R649 -3-11 pertaining to the location and drilling of a directional well.

QEP Energy Company would like to optimize the bottom hole spacing of the Mesa Verde
development; therefore,QEP Energy Company would like to drill this well directionally.

Furthermore, QEP Energy Company certifies that it is the sole working interest owner within460
feet of the entire directional well bore.

Therefore, based on the above stated information QEP Energy Company requests the permit be
granted pursuant to Rule R649-3-11.

Sincerely,

EP Energ

Jan Nelson
Permit



RECEIVED: May. 16, 2012

Sundry Number: 25810 API Well Number: 43047152900000
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RECEIVED: May. 16, 2012

Sundry Number: 25810 API Well Number: 43047152900000Sundry Number: 25810 API Well Number: 43047152900000

QEP Energy Company

QEP ENERGY (UT)
Red Wash
RW 23-26B
RW 23-26B

Re-Entry

Plan: Plan ver.0

Standard Planning Report
22 December, 2011

QEP Energy



RECEIVED: May. 16, 2012

Sundry Number: 25810 API Well Number: 43047152900000Sundry Number: 25810 API Well Number: 43047152900000

QEP Resources, Inc. gggg
Planning Report

Database: EDMDB_QEP Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well RW23-26B
Company; QEP ENERGY (UT) TVD Reference: RKB @5520.30usit (AZTEC 781)
Project; Red Wash MD Reference: RKB @5520.30usft (AZTEC781)
Site: RW 23-26B North Reference: True
Well: RW23-26B Suivey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: Re-Entry
Design: Plan ver.0

Project Red Wash

Map System: US State Plane 1983 System Datum: Mean Sea Level
Geo Datum: North American Datum 1983
Map Zone: Utah Central Zone Using geodetic scale factor

Site RW 23-268

Site Position: Northing: 7,241,412.961 usfl Latitude: 40.178739
From: Lat/Long Eastirig: 2,255,978.517 usfl Longitude: -109.296684

Position Uncertainty: 0.00 usft Slot Radius: 13-3/16 " Grid Gonvergence: 1.41 "

Well RW23-26B

Well Position +N/-S -0.01 usft Northing: 7,241,412.949 usit Latitude: 40.178739
+El-W 0.00 usft Easting: 2,255,978.517 usft Longitude: -109.296684

Position Uncertainty 0.00 usit Wellhead Elevation: 5,506.30 usft Ground Levek 5,506.30 usft

Wellbore Re-Entry

Magnetics Model Name Sample Date Declination Dip Angle Field Strength
(*) ( ) {nT)

IGRF2010 12/22/2011 10.95 66.04 52,398

Design Plan ver.0

Audit Notes:

Version: Phase: PLAN Tie On Depth: 0.00

Vertical Section: Depth From (TVD) +NI-S +El-W Direction
(usit) {usit} (usft) (°)
0.00 0.00 0.00 227.09

Plan Sections

Measured Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth inclination Azimuth Depth +Ni-S +El-W Rate Rate Rate TFO
(usft) (°) (°) (usft) (usft) {usft) (°l100usft) (°lfD0usft) {l100usft) (=) Target

0.00 0.00 0.00 0,00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

5 626.00 0.00 0.00 5,526.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5 850.00 0.00 0.00 6,650.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

6 512.66 15.10 252.28 6,602.71 -34.40 -107.63 1.75 1.75 0.00 252.28
7 136.66 15.10 252.28 7,105.17 -83.87 -262.43 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

8 143.09 0.00 0.00 8,100.00 -124.00 -388.00 1.50 -1.50 0.00 180.00

8 251.09 0.00 0.00 8,208.00 -124.00 -388.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
8 551.09 4.50 131.00 8,507.69 -131.73 -379.11 1.50 1.50 0.00 131.00

10 622.78 4.50 131.00 10,573.00 -238.36 -256.44 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

12/22/2011 9:15:05AM Page 2 COMPASS 5000 1 Build



RECEIVED: May. 16, 2012

Sundry Number: 25810 API Well Number: 43047152900000Sundry Number: 25810 API Well Number: 43047152900000

QEP Resources, Inc.
Planning Report

Database EOMDB_QEP Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well RW 23-26B

Company QEP ENERGY (UT) TVD Reference: RKB@5520.30usft (AZTEC 781)
Project: Red Wash MD Reference: RKB @5520.30usft (AZTEC 781)
Site: RW 23-268 North Reference: True
Well: RW 23-268 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: Re-Entry
Design: Plan ver.0

Planned Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate
(usft) ( ) ( ) (usft) (usit) (usit} (usft) ( 1100usft) (°1100usft) ( l100usft)

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5 528.00 0.00 0.00 5,526.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5 850.00 0.00 0.00 5,650.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
6 512.68 15.10 252.28 6,502.71 -34.40 -107.63 102.25 1.75 1.75 0.00
7 136.66 15.10 252.28 7,105.17 -83.67 -262.43 249.32 0.00 0.00 0.00

8,143.09 0.00 0.00 8,100.00 -124.00 -388.00 368.61 1.50 -1.50 0.00
8.251.09 0.00 0.00 8,208.00 -124.00 -388.00 368.61 0.00 0.00 0.00
8.551.09 4.50 131.00 8,507.69 -131.73 -379.11 367.36 1.50 1.50 0.00

10,622.78 4.50 131.00 10,573.00 -238.36 -256.44 350.11 0.00 0.00 0.00

Design Targets

Target Name
- hitimiss target Dip Angle Dip Dir. TVD +N/-S +El-W Northing Easting
- Shape (6) (°) (usft} (usft} (usft) (usft) (usft) Latitude Longitude

B26·11C1 0.00 0.00 8,200.00 -182.64 -320.35 7,241,222.490 2,255,662.790 40.178238 -109.297830

- plan misses target center by 89.53usft at 8243.09usft MD (8200.00 TVD, -124.00 N -388.00 E)
- Circle (radius 100.00)

Casing Points

Measured Vertical Casing Hole
Depth Depth Diameter Diameter
(usft) (usft) Name ( ) (")
5.526.00 5,526.00 7" 7 9

Formations

Measured Vertical Dip
Depth Depth Dip Direction
{usft) (usft) Name Lithology (°)
2,671.00 2,671.00 Green River 0.00

3,44G,00 3,440.00 Mahog. Bench 0.00

5,984.58 5,984.00 Wasatch 0.00
8,251.09 8,208.00 Mesaverde 0,00

10,522.47 10,473.00 Sego 0,00

12/22/2011 9:15:05AM Page 3 COMPASS 5000.1



RECEIVED: May. 16, 2012

Sundry Number: 25810 API Well Number: 43047152900000
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL,GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator: QEP ENERGY COMPANY Operator Account Number: N 3700

Address; 11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH

city VERNAL

state UT zip 84078 Phone Number: (435) 781-4369

Well 1
API Number Well Name QQ See Twp Rng County
4304715186 RW 21-228 NENW 22 7S 23E UINTAH
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment

Number Number Effective Date
D 5670 18478 12/5/2011 1/1/2012

Comments: A

OR\ T MMFD

Well2
API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rn County
4304715283 RW 31-288 NWNE 28 7S 23E UINTAH
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment

Number Number Effective Date
CommenD'

GRRV TO W

5670 18478 1/6/2012 1/20 2

Well 3
API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
4304715290 RW23-26B NESW 26 7S 23E UINTAH
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment

Number Number Effective Date

D 5670 18478 1/5/2012 1/1/2012
Comments:

GRRV TO WMMFD

ACTIONCODES:
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) Valyn Davis
B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unitwell) y ase Print)
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity Signature
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) Regulatory Affairs Analyst 4/12/2012

AECEIVED ""• °*•

(5/2000)

MAYLi 2012

of01 Gas &



RECEIVED: Dec. 12, 2013

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-0566 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 RED WASH 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 RW 23-26B 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047152900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 RED WASH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1979 FSL 1979 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 26 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

11 /1 /2012

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 INTERIM RECLAIMED IN THE FALL OF 2012, SEE ATTACHED BLM
APPROVED SUNDRY. FOR DOGM RECORD ONLY.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Amanda Taylor 435 247-1023

TITLE
 Reclamation Technician

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 12/12/2013

December 12, 2013

Sundry Number: 45840 API Well Number: 43047152900000Sundry Number: 45840 API Well Number: 43047152900000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING U-0566

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. RED WASH

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well RW 23-26B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047152900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext RED WASH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

1979 FSL 1979 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESW Section: 26 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

1 1/ 1/2 0 12
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

INTERIM RECLAIMED INTHE FALLOF 2012, SEE ATTACHED BLM Accepted by the
APPROVED SUNDRY. FOR DOGM RECORD ONLY. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
December 12, 2013

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Amanda Taylor 435 247-1023 Reclamation Technician

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 12/12/2013

RECEIVED: Dec. 12,



RECEIVED: Dec. 12, 2013

Form 3160-5
(August 2007) UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an

abandoned well.  Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

FORM APPROVED
OMB NO. 1004-0135
Expires: July 31, 2010

5.  Lease Serial No.
UTU0566

6.  If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side. 7.  If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
8920007610

1.  Type of Well

Oil Well Gas Well Other

8. Well Name and No.
RW 23-26B

2.  Name of Operator
QEP ENERGY COMPANY

Contact: AMANDA TAYLOR
E-Mail: amanda.taylor@qepres.com

9.  API Well No.
43-047-15290-00-S1

3a.  Address
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH
VERNAL, UT  84078

3b.  Phone No. (include area code)
Ph:  435-247-1023

10.  Field and Pool, or Exploratory
RED WASH

4.  Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)

Sec 26 T7S R23E NESW 1979FSL 1979FWL

11.  County or Parish, and State

UINTAH COUNTY, UT

12.  CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent

Subsequent Report

Final Abandonment Notice

Acidize

Alter Casing

Casing Repair

Change Plans

Convert to Injection

Deepen

Fracture Treat

New Construction

Plug and Abandon

Plug Back

Production (Start/Resume)

Reclamation

Recomplete

Temporarily Abandon

Water Disposal

Water Shut-Off

Well Integrity

Other

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA.  Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations.  If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed.  Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

RW 23-26B WAS DOWNSIZED AND RECLAIMED IN FALL 2012. RECLAMATION OPERATIONS FOLLOWED THE QEP ENERGY
COMPANY, UINTA BASIN DIVISION, RECLAMATION PLAN, SEPTEMBER 2009 AND THE BLM GREEN RIVER DISTRICT
RECLAMATION GUIDELINES.  RECLAMATION SPECIFIC TO THIS LOCATION INCLUDE:

1. ALL NON-ESSENTIAL EQUIPMENT AND DEBRIS WERE REMOVED.
2. AREAS NOT NEEDED FOR PRODUCTION OPERATIONS WERE RIPPED TO RELIEVE COMPACTION AND RECONTOURED TO
BLEND WITH THE SURROUNDING LANDSCAPE.  TOPSOIL WAS SPREAD TO THE APPROPRIATE DEPTH.
3. THE LOCATION WAS DISCED AND SEEDED WITH THE APPROVED SEED MIX.  CERTIFIED WEED FREE STRAW WAS
CRIMPED IN AT A RATE OF 1.5 TONS PER ACRE.

TOTAL DISTURBED AREA WAS 1.57 ACRES
THE RECLAIMED AREA IS 0.34 ACRES

14.  I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Electronic Submission #199876 verified by the BLM Well Information System

For QEP ENERGY COMPANY,  sent to the Vernal
Committed to AFMSS for processing by BOBBI SCHROEDER on 03/19/2013 (13BJS0377SE)

Name (Printed/Typed) AMANDA TAYLOR Title RECLAMATION TECHNICIAN

Signature (Electronic Submission) Date 02/25/2013

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved By TitleACCEPTED ACCEPTED
ACCEPTED Date 09/03/2013

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached.  Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Office Vernal

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

** BLM REVISED ** BLM REVISED ** BLM REVISED ** BLM REVISED ** BLM REVISED **

Sundry Number: 45840 API Well Number: 43047152900000Sundry Number: 45840 API Well Number: 43047152900000
3st16200057) UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT .

Expires: July 31, 2010
5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTUO566
Do not use this form for poposals to dri/I or to re-enter an

abandoned well. Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
8920007610

1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.

O Oil Well Gas Well O Other RW 23-26B

2. NameofOperator Contact: AMANDATAYLOR 9. APIWellNo.
QEP ENERGY COMPANY E-Mail: amanda.taylor@qepres.com 43-047-15290-00-S1

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH Ph: 435-247-1023 RED WASH
VERNAL, UT 84078

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, and State

Sec 26 T7S R23E NESW 1979FSL 1979FWL UINTAH COUNTY, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

. O Acidize O Deepen O Production (Start/Resume) O Water Shut-Off
O Notice of Intent

O Alter Casing O Fracture Treat B Reclamation O Well Integrity
Subsequent Report O Casing Repair O New Construction O Recomplete O Other

O Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon

O Convert to Injection O Plug Back O Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

RW23-26B WAS DOWNSIZED AND RECLAIMED IN FALL2012. RECLAMATION OPERATIONS FOLLOWED THE QEP ENERGY
COMPANY, UINTA BASIN DIVISION, RECLAMATION PLAN, SEPTEMBER 2009 AND THE BLM GREEN RIVER DISTRICT
RECLAMATION GUIDELINES. RECLAMATION SPECIFIC TO THIS LOCATION INCLUDE:

1. ALL NON-ESSENTIAL EQUIPMENT AND DEBRIS WERE REMOVED.
2. AREAS NOT NEEDED FOR PRODUCTION OPERATIONS WERE RIPPED TO RELIEVE COMPACTION AND RECONTOURED TO
BLEND WITH THE SURROUNDING LANDSCAPE. TOPSOIL WAS SPREAD TO THE APPROPRIATE DEPTH.
3. THE LOCATION WAS DISCED AND SEEDED WITH THE APPROVED SEED MIX. CERTIFIED WEED FREE STRAW WAS
CRIMPED INAT A RATE OF 1.5 TONS PER ACRE.

TOTAL DISTURBED AREA WAS 1.57 ACRES
THE RECLAIMED AREA IS 0.34 ACRES

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Electronic Submission #199876 verified by the BLM Well Information System

For QEP ENERGY COM: ANY, sent to the Vernal
Committed to AFMSS for processing by BOB :I SCHROEDER on 03/19/2013 (13BJSO377SE)

Name(Printed/Typed) AMANDATAYLOR Title RECLAMATION TECHNICIAN

Signature (Electronic Submission) Date 02/25/2013

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

ApprovedBy_A_C_C_E_PTE_D_
_ _ _ _ _ _ _

TitieACC D Date09/03/2013

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Office Vernal
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

** BLM REVISED ** BLM REVISED ** BLM REVISED ** BLM REVISED ** BLM REVISED **

RECEIVED: Dec. 12,



RECEIVED: Dec. 12, 2013

Additional data for EC transaction #199876 that would not fit on the form

32.  Additional remarks, continued

THE ACTIVE AREA IS 1.23 ACRES

THE ROW WILL BE MONITORED PER QEP'S RECLAMATION PLAN.

Sundry Number: 45840 API Well Number: 43047152900000Sundry Number: 45840 API Well Number: 43047152900000

Additional data for EC transaction #199876 that would not fit on the form

32. Additional remarks, continued

THE ACTIVE AREA IS 1.23 ACRES

THE ROW WILL BE MONITORED PER QEP'S RECLAMATION PLAN.

RECEIVED: Dec. 12,



RECEIVED: Dec. 12, 2013

Revisions to Operator-Submitted EC Data for Sundry Notice #199876

Operator Submitted BLM Revised (AFMSS)

Sundry Type: RECL RECL
SR SR

Lease: UTU0566 UTU0566

Agreement: RED WASH 8920007610 (UTU63010O)

Operator: QEP ENERGY COMPANY QEP ENERGY COMPANY
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH 11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH
VERNAL, UT  84078 VERNAL, UT  84078
Ph:  435-247-1023 Ph:  435-781-4032

Fx:  435-781-4045

Admin Contact: AMANDA TAYLOR AMANDA TAYLOR
RECLAMATION TECHNICIAN RECLAMATION TECHNICIAN
E-Mail: AMANDA.TAYLOR@QEPRES.COM E-Mail: amanda.taylor@qepres.com

Ph:  435-247-1023 Ph:  435-247-1023

Tech Contact: AMANDA TAYLOR AMANDA TAYLOR
RECLAMATION TECHNICIAN RECLAMATION TECHNICIAN
E-Mail: AMANDA.TAYLOR@QEPRES.COM E-Mail: amanda.taylor@qepres.com

Ph:  435-247-1023 Ph:  435-247-1023

Location:
State: UT UT
County: UINTAH UINTAH

Field/Pool: RED WASH RED WASH

Well/Facility: RW 23-26B RW 23-26B
Sec 26 T7S R23E NESW 1980FSL 1980FWL Sec 26 T7S R23E NESW 1979FSL 1979FWL
40.178740 N Lat, 109.296660 W Lon

Sundry Number: 45840 API Well Number: 43047152900000Sundry Number: 45840 API Well Number: 43047152900000

Revisions to Operator-Submitted EC Data for Sundry Notice #199876

Operator Submitted BLM Revised (AFMSS)

Sundry Type: RECL RECL
SR SR

Lease: UTUO566 UTUO566

Agreement: RED WASH 8920007610 (UTU630100)

Operator: QEP ENERGY COMPANY QEP ENERGY COMPANY
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH 11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH
VERNAL, UT 84078 VERNAL, UT 84078
Ph: 435-247-1023 Ph: 435-781-4032

Fx: 435-781-4045

Admin Contact: AMANDATAYLOR AMANDATAYLOR
RECLAMATION TECHNICIAN RECLAMATION TECHNICIAN
E-Mail: AMANDA.TAYLOR@QEPRES.COM E-Mail: amanda.taylor@qepres.com

Ph: 435-247-1023 Ph: 435-247-1023

Tech Contact: AMANDATAYLOR AMANDATAYLOR
RECLAMATION TECHNICIAN RECLAMATION TECHNICIAN
E-Mail: AMANDA.TAYLOR@QEPRES.COM E-Mail: amanda.taylor@qepres.com

Ph: 435-247-1023 Ph: 435-247-1023

Location:
State: UT UT
County: UINTAH UINTAH

Field/Pool: RED WASH RED WASH

Well/Facility: RW 23-26B RW 23-26B
Sec 26 T7S R23E NESW 1980FSL 1980FWL Sec 26 T7S R23E NESW 1979FSL 1979FWL
40.178740 N Lat, 109.296660 W Lon

RECEIVED: Dec. 12,



RECEIVED: Jun. 16, 2014

                           FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-0566 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 RED WASH 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 RW 23-26B 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047152900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 RED WASH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1979 FSL 1979 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 26 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

7 /1 /2014

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 QEP ENERGY COMPANY REQUESTS APPROVAL TO RECOMPLETE THE RW
23-26B BY ADDING PERFORATIONS TO THE EXISTING MESA VERDE

FORMATION AS FOLLOWS: 1. SET A CBP AT 9,840'. 2. STAGE 1:
9,543'-9,808', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT, FRAC WITH SLICKWATER. 3. SET A
CBP AT 9,500'. 4. STAGE 2: 9,343'-9,474', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT, FRAC

WITH SLICKWATER. 5. SET A CBP AT 9,290'. 6. STAGE 3: 9,073'-9,245',
3 SHOTS PER FOOT, FRAC WITH SLICKWATER. 7. DRILL OUT THE TOP

TWO PLUGS, BUT LEAVE THE BOTTOM PLUG. 8. RETURN WELL TO
PRODUCTION. 9. THE BOTTOM PLUG WILL BE REMOVED ONCE THE

PRESSURE FROM THE FRAC DECREASES.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Benna Muth 435 781-4320

TITLE
 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 6 /16 /2014

June 17, 2014

Sundry Number: 52142 API Well Number: 43047152900000Sundry Number: 52142 API Well Number: 43047152900000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING U-0566

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. RED WASH

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well RW 23-26B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047152900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext RED WASH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

1979 FSL 1979 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESW Section: 26 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

7/1/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP ENERGYCOMPANYREQUESTS APPROVALTO RECOMPLETETHE RW Accepted by the
23-26B BYADDING PERFORATIONS TO THE EXISTING MESA VERDE utah Division of

FORMATION AS FOLLOWS: 1. SET A CBP AT 9,840'. 2. STAGE 1: June'1 ing

9,543'-9,808', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT, FRAC WITH SLICKWATER. 3. SET A Date:
CBP AT 9,500'. 4. STAGE 2: 9,343'-9,474', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT, FRAC

WITH SLICKWATER. 5. SET A CBP AT 9,290'. 6. STAGE 3: 9,073'-9,245', sy: \ As/\
3 SHOTS PER FOOT, FRAC WITH SLICKWATER. 7. DRILLOUT THE TOP

TWO PLUGS, BUT LEAVETHE BOTTOM PLUG. 8. RETURN WELLTO
PRODUCTION. 9. THE BOTTOM PLUG WILLBE REMOVED ONCE THE

PRESSURE FROMTHE FRAC DECREASES.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Benna Muth 435 781-4320 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 6/16/2014

RECEIVED: Jun. 16,
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