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Approval expires 12-3140.

Form 9-881a
(Feb. 1951)

(SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE)
Land OHice

UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
GEOLOGICAL SURVEY

808
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

NOTlCE OF INTENTIONTO DRILL ...

SUBSEQUENTREPORT OF WATER SHUT-OFF,

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO CHANGE PLANS. SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO TEST WATER SHUT-OFF SUBSEQUENTREPORT OF ALTERINGCASING .

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO RE-DRILL OR REPAIR WELL SUBSEQUENTREPORT OF RE-DRILLING OR REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO SHOOT OR ACIDIZE- SUBSEQUENTREPORT OF ABANDONMENT

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO PULL OR ALTER CASING SUPPLEMENTARY WELL HISTORY.

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO ABANDON WELL

(INDICATE ABOVE BY CHECK MARK NATUREOF REPORT, NOTICE, OR OTHER DATA)

UMh. abreaag 1 , 1961..

WellNo. is locate ft. from line and g ft. from line of sec. gg

The elevation of th ove sea level igggÿ ft· (finaM
DETAILS OF WORK

(State names of and expected depths to objective sands; show sizes, weights, and lengths of proposed casings; indicate mudding jobs, cement-

ing points, and all other important proposed work)

14 is proposed to drill a test well ter eil er gee to be oompleted
in me EmmerGreen Mmer Permetten, 30.3/k* enskas to be semented at
2855, 7* eesing to be eenented below lomarmest prednetive katerial
with enttistent eemanoto tul &ove 40005.

Top armenRiver 3033*
x Paina 4890•
K Point $480*

I understand that this plan of work must receive approval in writing by the Coological Survey before operations may be commenced.

Company ---CSA$$998&B 041 p--WOWAMPA-RVisì$8- ---

Address .. gag_ggg

Title 849 Supe &atandesk-------
GPO 8
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ydget Bureau No. 42-R355.4.
Approval expires 12-31-00.

Form 9-330

U. S. LAND Orriez .--- ...

SERIAL NUMBER ---. ------

LEASE OR ŸERMIT To PaosrECT ----...

UNITED STATES
7

-- S DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

--X-- GEOLOGICAL SURVEY

LOG OF OIL OR GAS WELL
LOCATE WELL CORRECTLY

Company ÑÑÊ9¾ë ..s.J_9_s¾..NY•. Address _ _ _

Egx $$_,_yernal.,
_U_tah

Lessor or Tract ....._....._. _ _ _ _ _...... Field --- 894 Jaah_
_ _ _ _ _ .. State ...

Well No. . Sec. 22 T. 18. R.211. Meridian __Salt.Lake--- --.... County ...IÎ$RÌAh

Location2OI3.Aft. N. of ...S. Line and _660. ft. JE. of -..X. Line of ..Section 22 ... Elevation ¼87.8* IB
[W• (Derrick 11 ive to sea leveL)

The information given herewith is a complete and correct record of the well and all wo e thereon
so far as can be determined from all available records.

Signed -- .... __.---.R_..La.GRann

Date ..--........W--Ex.N.6À_.......
___......--

Title...... .. ...A ..

The summary on this page is for the condition of the well at above date.

Commenced drilling .....Xebralaxy..21_. , 1961.. Finished drilling ....... ...March 27..... 1961-

OIL OR GAS SANDS OR ZONES

ggg gg gg) (Denote gas by G)

No. 1, from....¾ .. .. to ...$.606....
__.... No. 4, from ...........5671..... to ... .5675

No. 2, from.. Ë631 .. .. to ... 632.... _ __ No. 5, from ......_ ..._ $687......to _ _ _ .5688

No. 3, from.. 1639 . to 42... ..-.. No. 6, from -----------5702------ to -----57.05

9646 to 5712 to 5714
ORTANT WATER SANDS

No. 1, from.. . to ... ..... No. 3, from .. .................... to .

No. 2, from . to .. ......... No. 4, from ........................ to .

CASING RECORD

e i g pe
per Make Amount Kind of shoe Out and pulled from

Fro

Perforated

n xots or orr om eve 5639 5642 5712.571&
Jan Shka

un 5662
IVIUDDING AND CEMENTING RECORD

here set Number saÃksof cement 3Éethod used Mud gravity Amount of mud used

10-3/h 2231-- 16o..sax..I al..const.-
935L hoo-sax--I al claae-4 ce e

PLUGS A D
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Adapters Material. ..
. Size

SHOOTING RECORD

Size Shell used E osive used Qu ntity Date Depth shot Depth cleaned out

TOO S USED

Rotary tools were used fro feet to . gg... . feet, and from ..... . feet to ..... feet

Cable tools were used from feet to _ _ _ _ _ _ _ feet, and from . .... . feet to .......... feet
D TES

... , 19 Put to producing .... ...... ......, 19 ..

The production for the first 24 hours was ..... barrels of fluid of which' - % was oil; %
emulsion; .2% water; and ..... % sediment. Gravity, °Bé.

...

If gas well, cu. ft. per 24 hours --- -- Gallons gasoline per 1,000 cu. ft. of gas .

Rock pressure, lbs. per sq. in. ------.

EMPLOYEES
., Driller ----. ...

---.........-........_... , Driller

., Driller .._.. ......_ _ _ _...._ _ _............. , Driller

FORMAT ON RECORD

FROM--- TO- TOTAL FEET FORMATION

O' 3024' 3024* Shale arxi sand

302h' 5936• 2912* Sand and shale

LEON JO - 101« EEEI LOß¾YLI X

EOKIAIV,LIOIA K ECOKD -Co
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WELLNO: 13.228 (148) PROPERTY: Section 228 RED WASHFIELD

HISTORYOF OIL OR GAS WELL

Cemented 18" conductor at 221 with 20 sacks oement.

Karr Mo0ee 011 Indmatries, Inc. moved in and rigged up. Well apudded 12 s01 A.M.
February 21, 1961. Drilled 1§¤ hole to 226 e

.

cemented10-3/4" casing at 223* with 160 eacka Ideal Const cement.

February 22, 1961 to March 10 1961
Drilled 9 hole fran 226* to 58669.

March 11, 1961
Drilled 9* hole from $8669to $9399.
Ran Schlumberger IES from $9369to 223*. (Schlumberger piakap at 59399.) Top
Green River 3024* (/2664'), G h669*, H 48839, I $0819, J $360*, K $483 , K Sh838
(/206'), Kg $$6&•,Ig $6259,Ky $6816, L $738*, La 68320. Ranxicrolog $936-
2000*. Shot 22 selecuve sidewall aamples, ree 19.
Depth Rec. Desortption
4657' 3/h" Be, wh, y in gr, ang, fri, some wh c1g¶ ces, low por and

pera, NSOFC. Water.
h676• 3/h" Se, wh, y in gr, eilty, much wh clay cem, ught, mottled

dull orange-gold fluor, no stain. Gas.
479&' In Se, wh, y in gr, ang, some wh clay com, Mght, gry SH

parunga, mot.tled canary yellow fluor, no stain. Gaso
h807' 1" Se, 14 gry, brn, fn gr, ang, silly, wall cem, tLght,

much dk bra dead hydrocarbon residae, 14 yellow fluore
Gaa.

5062* 3/h" Se, wh, y in gr; sub ag, fri, poor por & pera, some wh
olay cem, NSOPC. Water.$110* 1" Se, 14 gry-wh, y fine gr sabrnded, fri, fair por & perm,
spotty dull golden fluor & apot,t,y It, brn oil etn. Water.

$1699 1/2" Se, 14 gry, y in gr, ang, y fri, good por & pera, even lt,
brn oil etn, even orange-golden fluor. 011.

$158' 3/h" Se, wh, y in gr, ang, y fri, excel por & pei•m, motAled
orange•-golden £1uor, mottled 14 brn oil etn. 011 - water.

$242* 3/4* Se, dk gry, y th gr - fn gr, ailly, low por & pera,
apot,ig dead b1k oil (?) residne, dull bro fluor. 011 (?).

$¼$7' 3/h" Sa, wh, 1†. gry, it..med gr, ang, y fi•i, excel por & pera,
y lt, bra oil ein, bright gold- fluor. 011 or gas.

5603* 2/2" Se, lt, gry, v £h-In gr, ruded, mod fri, excel por & perm,
even 14 bra oil etn, even dull gold £1uor. 011.

6607' 3/h" SAA, fair por & perm. OLlo
$792* 1A" Se, lt, gry, fn-med gr, sub ang, y fri, exo por & pera,

mot.t,1ed 14 brn oil stn, mottled dull gold fluor. Water (?).
57969 1A* SAA. Water
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WEt.LNO: 13-228 (148) PROPERTY: SectLon 22B RED WASHFIELD

Depth Reo. Descripuon
$802* 3/h" SAA, some dk brn patch oil stn, even dull gold fluor.

Water.$¾28 0 No recovery.$822* 1" Ss, lt gry, wh, in gr, sub ang, y fri, good por & pera,
NSOFC. Water.

$836* 3/h" Se, 14 gry-wh, al sep, y in grn, sub rnded, y fri, good
por & pera, NSOFC. Water.

5838* 3/h" sAA. Water.$$¾38 1/24 SAA, mot.tled 14 brn oil stn, motded dull gold fluor.
Water.$887* 3/hn Se, 14 gry, ¿Ls & p, y in gr, sub ruded, fri, tight,
NSOFC. Water.

$889' O No recovery.

March 12 1961
DST #1 iËterval9789-5803*. Set packere at $789,$784, $8039. Took 30 min
ISIP. Opened tool to are at 6:00 A.M. Had good blair air steadily declining
to weak at end 1 hr. No gas to sfc. Took 46 min.FSIP. Pulled tools & reo
2220*. Top 60 oily watery and, 90e oily mddy water, 20700 ali mddy gassy
water grading to clear salt water, 0.75 ohamsters at top to 0.68 ohmmeters
at tool (e 65 F). Charte indicate tool funokoned properly, packere held.
Pressum IN ISIP IF FF FSIP FH
Middle 2952 1958 3h8 962 1908 2928

DST #2 interval SlÃ¾=6hg98.Set packers Shh0, 5496, $¼$99. Gas to surface
2 mins while taking iniMal flor. Took 30 min ISIP. Opened tool at 2:10
P.M., had 1.59WCF/day gas. Gas headed between 1.59 to 1.80 BCF/D for 30
min. Shnt, tool in at 2 shO P.M., teok 30 min FSIP. Pulled and recovered
$13*. Top 500*is gassy, slighty muddy, black 106© F PP oil. Bottom 13*
oily muddy water. Charts irxiioate tool ihre tLoned properly.
Pressure IH ISIP IF FF FSIP FR
Botton 2728 2116 212 370 2092 2728

March 13, 1961
Ran 7* casing to 59399and cemented at $939' With 400 sacks Ideal Class I
construckon cement.

March Ik,1961.
Cleaned out to 98904and displaced mud in hole with salt water.
Ran McCullough GanunnLog from $886*to h3009. 66949Me r. $7004Soh;
$$hhaNo : $$$0*Sche
Landed 2-1/21* tubing at $162· with Dowell verMoal notching tool on bottoa.
Tubing details
Top 7.10* KB to top armulus frac head
Next 181 .its

$749.3382-1/2" EUE 6.6# Ja66 new CF&I tbg.
Bot,tam 6.20* Collar locator and vertical notching tool

PlaTTF
Kerr-Mo0ee released 12 :00 Noon, March Ih,
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WELLNO: 13428 (1hô) 80PERTY: Section 228 RED WASHFIELD

March 21, 1961
R&RWell Se ce moved4n and rigged up.

March 22, 1
Cut verMoally opposed notohes $71h-97120and 6706-=9702*at 7-1/2 BPMat
3900 pai, using1-2/h#fgal 20-40 eand and J100 friction redmoing agent.
Cut verkos11y opposed notehes $688.56879,5676-§671•and $662-9660*4

March $3, 1
Sand-water Traced down 7" casing with 660 bols water treated with anti-
emulsion agent, fluid loss agent, and containing 21,000# 20-40 sand and
600# 12-16 aluminun pellets. Broke down with 100 bble treated water,
followed by 360 bble containing 1# sandfgal. Pumped in 1000 gallone with
0.3# aluminum/gai. Dropped SC# lon-temp moth balls, pumped in 6400 gal
with 1#sandfgel fóllowed by 0.3# aluminum per gallon water (1000 gallons).
Flashed with 22¶ bble waiar (includes pumps and linea), first 700 gallone
with 2#fgagon sand to cover perfs. Average rate 97 BPM, max pressure
1900 poi, min pressure 1200 poi, inst shut in 700 pei. No indication of
moth ballaipne
Located collare, ou¾notches vertically at 5649-6646*,56h2-6639',6632-
5631*, 56od-56oeand 5573-5968•.
Spotted 350 galions and acid at $6b98

.

Broke down notches $649-6660'at 1800 pai¡, rate 7-1/2 BPR at 3000 pai down
ibg. Rate 17 BFMat 3000 pai down casing, instantaneous shut down 600 pai.
Circula ted 'sand £111 at 56945 .

March 4, 1961
Sand-water fraced down 7" osaing with 800 bble lease waste water cont.aining
antwaion agent and fluid loss agent, with 27,000# 20.h0 sand and 600#
12-36 alunannm pellets. Pumped in100 bble pad at2000-1800 pai, pumped
in 20,000 gale with 1#fgal sand at 1800-1600 pai and $1 BPM. Pumped in
1000 gals with 0.3# aluminus/gal, dropped 50# low tempmoth balle. Pumped
in 7000 gal w/1# aang/gal, 1000 gal with 0.3# aluminus/gal, flushed wit.h
219 bble water. Flashed at 2660 pai and 36 BPM. Max pressure 2900, min
pressure 1600 pai, over..all rate 65 BPM. Inst. shut, in 850 psi.

March 26, 1961
McCulloughran Gamma-Tracer Log $891-4300'.
Hong prodnetton string inbing at,67709.
Tubing details
Bottom 31.25* 2-3/2" perf*d gas anchor
Next 8.109 2..1/2* tubing sub
Next 0.95' PSN (at $730.789)
Naxt $717.839 180 Jta 2-1/2" UE 6.6# J-69 tbg.
Top 12.005 IB in ibg head

Depth

Page 3

WELLNO: 13428 (1hô) 80PERTY: Section 228 RED WASHFIELD

March 21, 1961
R&RWell Se ce moved4n and rigged up.

March 22, 1
Cut verMoally opposed notohes $71h-97120and 6706-=9702*at 7-1/2 BPMat
3900 pai, using1-2/h#fgal 20-40 eand and J100 friction redmoing agent.
Cut verkos11y opposed notehes $688.56879,5676-§671•and $662-9660*4

March $3, 1
Sand-water Traced down 7" casing with 660 bols water treated with anti-
emulsion agent, fluid loss agent, and containing 21,000# 20-40 sand and
600# 12-16 aluminun pellets. Broke down with 100 bble treated water,
followed by 360 bble containing 1# sandfgal. Pumped in 1000 gallone with
0.3# aluminum/gai. Dropped SC# lon-temp moth balls, pumped in 6400 gal
with 1#sandfgel fóllowed by 0.3# aluminum per gallon water (1000 gallons).
Flashed with 22¶ bble waiar (includes pumps and linea), first 700 gallone
with 2#fgagon sand to cover perfs. Average rate 97 BPM, max pressure
1900 poi, min pressure 1200 poi, inst shut in 700 pei. No indication of
moth ballaipne
Located collare, ou¾notches vertically at 5649-6646*,56h2-6639',6632-
5631*, 56od-56oeand 5573-5968•.
Spotted 350 galions and acid at $6b98

.

Broke down notches $649-6660'at 1800 pai¡, rate 7-1/2 BPR at 3000 pai down
ibg. Rate 17 BFMat 3000 pai down casing, instantaneous shut down 600 pai.
Circula ted 'sand £111 at 56945 .

March 4, 1961
Sand-water fraced down 7" osaing with 800 bble lease waste water cont.aining
antwaion agent and fluid loss agent, with 27,000# 20.h0 sand and 600#
12-36 alunannm pellets. Pumped in100 bble pad at2000-1800 pai, pumped
in 20,000 gale with 1#fgal sand at 1800-1600 pai and $1 BPM. Pumped in
1000 gals with 0.3# aluminus/gal, dropped 50# low tempmoth balle. Pumped
in 7000 gal w/1# aang/gal, 1000 gal with 0.3# aluminus/gal, flushed wit.h
219 bble water. Flashed at 2660 pai and 36 BPM. Max pressure 2900, min
pressure 1600 pai, over..all rate 65 BPM. Inst. shut, in 850 psi.

March 26, 1961
McCulloughran Gamma-Tracer Log $891-4300'.
Hong prodnetton string inbing at,67709.
Tubing details
Bottom 31.25* 2-3/2" perf*d gas anchor
Next 8.109 2..1/2* tubing sub
Next 0.95' PSN (at $730.789)
Naxt $717.839 180 Jta 2-1/2" UE 6.6# J-69 tbg.
Top 12.005 IB in ibg head

Depth



Page &
WELLN0s 13-228 (1h8) PROPERTY: Section 22B RED WASHFIELD

Ran product1.on siring rode, clamped off polish rod.
Rod detail:
1 pump No. 138, inp-3-oup
6h x 3A"x 29 plain
68 x 3Anx 26 * 'u.H.
99 x 7/8* x 25* W.H.
1 - he, 1 - 69, 1 - lot x 7/84 subs (plain)
1 - 22* P.R. 1.1/2*

March 27, 1961
R&R Well Service

Page &
WELLN0s 13-228 (1h8) PROPERTY: Section 22B RED WASHFIELD

Ran product1.on siring rode, clamped off polish rod.
Rod detail:
1 pump No. 138, inp-3-oup
6h x 3A"x 29 plain
68 x 3Anx 26 * 'u.H.
99 x 7/8* x 25* W.H.
1 - he, 1 - 69, 1 - lot x 7/84 subs (plain)
1 - 22* P.R. 1.1/2*

March 27, 1961
R&R Well Service
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SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO DRILL.._ ___ _....._ _____ SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF WATER SHUT-OFF

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO CHANGE PLANS_ ___________. SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF SHOOTINGOR ACIDIZING

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO TEST WATER SHUT4)FF-----. SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ALTERING CASING .

NOTICE OF INTgNTION TO RE-DRILL OR REPAIR WELL.. SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF RE-DRILLING OR REPAIR. ...
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th
, 19 $

4).-)
WellNo. .. is located t. from ne and ft. from line of sec. ...M

(¼ Bec. and Sec. No.) (Twp.) (Range) (Meridian)

Met 18104 Wabak mak
(iráiä) (öoänii iduiiãf isi n) (siäiics TFühn)

The elevation of the ve sea level is Reift.
DETAILS OF WORK

(State names of and expected depths to objective sands; show sizes, weightsmand lengths of proposed casings; indicate mudding jobs, cement-
ing points, and all other important proposed work)

1. Sans etA dideMis 3eets e Ny • & WheeseA & Osas stigte.
a. maamagea . W Mata e (20 wasans.
s. ammesgog - de• gets e saw aan aan.
4. annanman to assaannen.

I understand that this plan of work must receive approval in writing by the Coological Survey before operations may be commenced.
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No

- -·- - UNITED STATES
--- ---- --- y DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
.E._

. .... ___

Ñ GEOLOGICAL SURVEY

a 23 a
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO DRILL -----........... _.._......___......_ SUBSEQUENTREPORT OF WATER SHUT-OFF
....

NOTICE OF INTENTIONTO CHANGEPLANS_______..______......._ ...___ SUBSEQUENTREPORT OF SHOOTINGOR ACIDIZING.
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO TEST WATER SHUT-OFF._
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(U-aa)
WellNo. .... is located *

. from ine and ft. from line of sec.

(¼ Sec. an,1 Bec. No.) (Twp.) (Range) (Meridian)

Bei mak Utatah Utah

The elevation of the ve sea level is ft.

DETAILS OF WORK
(State names of and expected depths to objective sands; show sizes, weightsgand lengths of proposed casings; indicate mudding jobs, cement-

ing points, and all other important proposed work)

me tonestas seek was permosuma en as sah,)eet won.
1. Attemptet to seleettysty tamaan estattas parte ansept as xy . r. satersmasa

arme stesse. sea.aue.a.a ---•-+•- aeroes alaaks. rameetsorte asunme omstas.
a. Abanoths**sa 3 - do* aleta at Saba• (Ig) aat taaseâ.
3. Abrasidettaa 3 • 60* alots se pass* (za)••& famo•*•
4. anternetvan to sweessaana.

Proenessans angese. 8 asse, o amo, 88)
After - 83 BWB, 3 aan, 405 .

I understand that this plan of work must receive approval in writing by the Geological Survey before operations may be commenced.

Galiteesta OLLCongang, WesternatvistaaCompany .....----------------------....

P. O. Som 4§§Address . ...

. ...... -- By ..

Title
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1¯ai) ITED STATES SUBMIT IN TR.,-ulCATE* g°1Ëeta .No.
42-R1424.

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Pr*Asidi structions on re-
. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY • $1
6. Ir INDIAN, ALLOTTEB OR TRIBE NA31E

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

1. 7. UNI AGREËIMENT NAME

ELL ELL OTHER

2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FÁRM OR LEASÉNAbiB7

Chevrea 041 Company, Westera Division
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

7. 0. Box 455, Termal, Utah 84078 Slatt #1#8 $¾228)
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10 IFIgD AND POOL. OR WILP

See also space 17 below.)
At surface

660' WL and 2073.4* FSL of See. 22, TTS, 8238, SLM =g,24=
,||

gisei 22, 778; 8238
14. PERhlIT No. 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 1 . ÒOUNTY OR PARISH 13. STM/

KB • $681.8' Mágab Utah
16 CheckAppropriate BoxTo indicate Nature of Notice, Report,or Other Í¾ta

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO : SUBSEQUBÍNT REPORT OF :

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT 3IULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASIN

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABÄNDONMENT

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANs (Other)
(NoTE : Report testilts of multiple cogplet1õn on We?

(Other) ggg $1g Completion or Recamgüetjo¾ Report and Log fokm )
17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting ary

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical deþths for all mtirkers and zones perd
nent to this work.) *

It te proposed to convert subject well to water tajection ta the L lbre Ig getsivals and
continue oil proenetten from the 18b thru Kr intervals se followei

1. Set fras liner across interval 5550•5730 (oever Kg•xy parta). Beterse hate w water.
2. Clean out to 7820 at 5892', drt11 out fleet and cemnt to 5915*.
3. Retrieve tras liaer. Kun CEL, ra•-ne as warranted.
4. Portorate at 5760, 5767 (L), 5777, 5782 (LAls $791, 5795, SSOgg#$11, 5819 (LAa).

$827, 5836, 5841 (Lg) 58691(LC) and 5869 (Lg) w/ 5-vay *••a joka, asleetteely
br••¾A- and pmp test. Wertora smit tubing sand•water tras os any L•Ig parts
that vill not take an adequate volume of water.

5. Set Model "B" Production Packer at $750*.

6. RIS w/ 2 3/8" injection string, latch into Medal "D" and lamit injection string on
dual hanger at + 5763*.

7. aan 2 1/8* pation strias and land at + 5686.35'.
8. Run pmp sad rods.
9. Return veli to predestion and --•••• injection

APPROVED BYUTAHOi AND gAsPresent Productient 60 BOFD, 26 BRED, 1044 NCyp, CONSERYATIONCOMMiSSJON

Chief Petroleum ingn.
18. I hereby certif t t true and correct

SIGNED R. W. PATTERSON TITLE $ ARPST DAos $$*¾
a u Javvenggq

(This space for Federal or State ofBee use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY :

*See Instructionson ReverseSide

USGS, SLC•3; OBBCC,SLC-2; Asti, Okla. City•1; Gulf, Casper-1; Caulkins•1; 8-ble. Denver-1;
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$827, 5836, 5841 (Lg) 58691(LC) and 5869 (Lg) w/ 5-vay *••a joka, asleetteely
br••¾A- and pmp test. Wertora smit tubing sand•water tras os any L•Ig parts
that vill not take an adequate volume of water.

5. Set Model "B" Production Packer at $750*.

6. RIS w/ 2 3/8" injection string, latch into Medal "D" and lamit injection string on
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(This space for Federal or State ofBee use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY :

*See Instructionson ReverseSide

USGS, SLC•3; OBBCC,SLC-2; Asti, Okla. City•1; Gulf, Casper-1; Caulkins•1; 8-ble. Denver-1;



S'a š> 0 (ED STATES SUBMIT IN TRI ;ATE. Form ap roved.
2-R

DEPARTMt.riT OF THE INTERIOR Pr*A
sid

structio- on re-
5. LEASE AT O N E IAL NO

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY gwÔgl
SUNDRYNOTKES AND REPORTSON WELLS

$. IF INÐIAN, ALLOTT10B OB TRIBE NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

1. 7 NIT AGREEMENT NAME

ELL
ESLL

OTHER

2. NAME OF OPERATOR AEK OB LEASE WAME

Chevren 011 Company, Westera Division
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. WBiL NO.

P. o. aanAss, vernat, utah 84078 anst414e (n-tas)
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10. FIELD AND 2001., OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
At surface

660* WW.and 2073.4' FSL of Sec. 22. T78, 8238, SLBM n. pg; g. .. BLW AND

$wa 22y 178, $235, BLEN
14. PERAIIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONs (Show whether DF, RT, on, etc.) 12. COUNTY on PARISH 18. STATE

EB • 5687.8 Ogpagh Stah
is CheckAppropriate BoxTo Indicate Nature oFNotice, Report,or Otherana

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO : SUBSEQUEN RÉÊÖ¾T OF i

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF BEPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TBEAT 3IULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASIliG

SHOOT OR ACIDIzE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIEING ABANDOÑMÌIINT

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)
(NoTE : Report testüts of multiple comþledon on Wel

(Other) - Completion or Recomplety Repprt and Log formd

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CO31PLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, inelgding estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical deÿthe for all markers and s¡ones perti-
nent to this work.) *

Subject well was eenverted to water injection in the L through Ag istoWala and ¾ill
contiano to prodene ott from the Igh through myintervate. Subjedt weak was sempleted
11•t2•66.

1. Cleaned eat to Fan at $892, drt11ad out tioat cetter and comet to 5915*.
2. Kan CBL, no •=-neing aseessary.
3. Parterated at SHO, 5767 (L), 5777. 5782 (LA), 5791, 5795, $$ Salt, $$19 (LAa)·

saar, 5836, 5841 (Lg), 5869 (LC) and 5889 (Lo) w/ 5-ear eenim te, beobadown
parts L through Ig and pump tested.

4. set andet "s" pueduction peaker at 5750*
5. xxxv/ 2" angeweentajaetten strias tuotas, latehad tato Meigt a" ymmama**anpar

and landed at 5761.32'.
6. mzav/ 2 7/8" r-h=•*- enktas and tended at 5683.09'.
7. sta w/ pump and rede.

this to to be a stagle well tajector.

Prior Produetten: 60 MSD, 26 -90, 1044 Mc&B.
Prodsatten After Joka 35 MPD, 78 Was, 1061 Mers.

Inittet lajestions $473 WSD at 2340 poi
18. I hereby certify thgt the foregoing is true and correctongmalsaanedbY gagg ggggginwanamne 1.gg.gy

SIGNED TITLE DATE

(This space for Federal or State ofBee use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY :

*See Instructionson ReverseSide
88. SLC•3; OMCC, SLC•2; Gult, Okla. City•1; delt, Casper•1; Canthine•1; thumble. Denver•1;
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SHOOT OR ACIDIzE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIEING ABANDOÑMÌIINT

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)
(NoTE : Report testüts of multiple comþledon on Wel

(Other) - Completion or Recomplety Repprt and Log formd

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CO31PLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, inelgding estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical deÿthe for all markers and s¡ones perti-
nent to this work.) *

Subject well was eenverted to water injection in the L through Ag istoWala and ¾ill
contiano to prodene ott from the Igh through myintervate. Subjedt weak was sempleted
11•t2•66.

1. Cleaned eat to Fan at $892, drt11ad out tioat cetter and comet to 5915*.
2. Kan CBL, no •=-neing aseessary.
3. Parterated at SHO, 5767 (L), 5777. 5782 (LA), 5791, 5795, $$ Salt, $$19 (LAa)·

saar, 5836, 5841 (Lg), 5869 (LC) and 5889 (Lo) w/ 5-ear eenim te, beobadown
parts L through Ig and pump tested.

4. set andet "s" pueduction peaker at 5750*
5. xxxv/ 2" angeweentajaetten strias tuotas, latehad tato Meigt a" ymmama**anpar

and landed at 5761.32'.
6. mzav/ 2 7/8" r-h=•*- enktas and tended at 5683.09'.
7. sta w/ pump and rede.

this to to be a stagle well tajector.

Prior Produetten: 60 MSD, 26 -90, 1044 Mc&B.
Prodsatten After Joka 35 MPD, 78 Was, 1061 Mers.

Inittet lajestions $473 WSD at 2340 poi
18. I hereby certify thgt the foregoing is true and correctongmalsaanedbY gagg ggggginwanamne 1.gg.gy

SIGNED TITLE DATE

(This space for Federal or State ofBee use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY :

*See Instructionson ReverseSide
88. SLC•3; OMCC, SLC•2; Gult, Okla. City•1; delt, Casper•1; Canthine•1; thumble. Denver•1;



ra
) a TED STATES sg,sh MINr

le
eap .No. 42-R142À.

DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR verse side) 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY
. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

1. 7, UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

ELL
ESLL

OTHER

NAME OF OPERATOR , FARM OB LEASE NAME

Chevron 011 Company, Western Sivision
ADDRESS OF OPERATOR Û. WELL NO.

r. o. a.. Ass, var..x, se.a a4oys noteetes «
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 1Ò. FIþLD AND POOL OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
At surface

660' FNL and 2073.4' FSL of Sec. 22, T78, R238, SLER 11... r..a..... BLK.AND

Aas... 22 TFL 1238, SLEK
14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 12. dOUNTY O PARISIf .18. STATE

58 - 5687.8 Wintah Utah
16 CheckAppropriate BoxTo Indicate Nature of Notice, Report,or OtherData

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO : SUBSEQUENT BNPORT OF :

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF BEPAIRING WELL

FRACTORE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDON3diNT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANs (Other)

(Other) gg ggg (gg gggggggi upSti R o pledo
ti le co pLeuonon Wel

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and gones perti-
nent to this work.) *

It is propeeed to cease oil production at subject weit and ta additten to injetttag
into the & through Lg intervale (5760•5889) we will equip the well to inject into
the Eg through Ky interval. These intervate will be separated by a paoker and will
make this a dual injection well.

The new injection intervals will be 5568-73, 5602-06 (Ky), 563t•32, 5639-42, 3646•49
(Kg), 5660•62, 3671•75 (Kg) and 5687•88, 5702•05, 5712•1A (Ky).

Present production: Shut•in.
Present injection : 2438 MFD at 1940 pet.

18. I hereby certify th the ‡ogegoin is true and correct

SIGNED TITLE $ ÊMgSËÊÊË DATE
R. W. PAT†ERSIÀI

(This space for Federal or State ofBee use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY :

*See Instructionson ReverseSide

08, SLC-38 OMCC, SLC•2; Salt, Okla. City•1; Gulf. Casper•1; Cantkine•1; Bumble, Denvar•1;

ra
) a TED STATES sg,sh MINr

le
eap .No. 42-R142À.

DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR verse side) 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY
. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

1. 7, UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

ELL
ESLL

OTHER

NAME OF OPERATOR , FARM OB LEASE NAME

Chevron 011 Company, Western Sivision
ADDRESS OF OPERATOR Û. WELL NO.

r. o. a.. Ass, var..x, se.a a4oys noteetes «
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 1Ò. FIþLD AND POOL OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
At surface

660' FNL and 2073.4' FSL of Sec. 22, T78, R238, SLER 11... r..a..... BLK.AND

Aas... 22 TFL 1238, SLEK
14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 12. dOUNTY O PARISIf .18. STATE

58 - 5687.8 Wintah Utah
16 CheckAppropriate BoxTo Indicate Nature of Notice, Report,or OtherData

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO : SUBSEQUENT BNPORT OF :

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF BEPAIRING WELL

FRACTORE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDON3diNT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANs (Other)

(Other) gg ggg (gg gggggggi upSti R o pledo
ti le co pLeuonon Wel

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and gones perti-
nent to this work.) *

It is propeeed to cease oil production at subject weit and ta additten to injetttag
into the & through Lg intervale (5760•5889) we will equip the well to inject into
the Eg through Ky interval. These intervate will be separated by a paoker and will
make this a dual injection well.

The new injection intervals will be 5568-73, 5602-06 (Ky), 563t•32, 5639-42, 3646•49
(Kg), 5660•62, 3671•75 (Kg) and 5687•88, 5702•05, 5712•1A (Ky).

Present production: Shut•in.
Present injection : 2438 MFD at 1940 pet.

18. I hereby certify th the ‡ogegoin is true and correct

SIGNED TITLE $ ÊMgSËÊÊË DATE
R. W. PAT†ERSIÀI

(This space for Federal or State ofBee use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY :

*See Instructionson ReverseSide

08, SLC-38 OMCC, SLC•2; Salt, Okla. City•1; Gulf. Casper•1; Cantkine•1; Bumble, Denvar•1;



2",'dü> L TED STATES sgsh MINr et No. 42-It1424.

DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR verse side)
o. on re-

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY $•ÛÊi

SUNDRYNOTKES AND REPORTSON WELLS
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTES OR TRIBE NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

ELL
SLL

OTHER Water Injection Red Wash
NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FARM OR LEASE NAMB

Chevron 011 Company, Western Division
.

ADDRESS OF OPERATOR A. WEL NO.

P. O. Box 455, Veraal, Utah Batt #148 (13•223)
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10. TIELD AND POOL, OB WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
At surface

660' FM, and 2073.4' PSL of See. 22, T78, R238 11... r.,a.,... BI,K.AND

See. 22. TTS, R238
14. PERMIT No. 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT. GR, etc.) 12, COUNTY OR PARISH 18. STATE

KB • 5687.8 Utstah Utah

16 CheckAppropriate BoxTo Indicate Nature of Notice, Report,or OtherData
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO : SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF :

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TBEAT 3IULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIEING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANs (Other) EU$¾
(NoTE: Report resalts of multiþ1e contpletion on Wel

(Other) Completion or Recognpletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and gones perti-

nent to this work.) *

On 7/26/67 subject well was equipped to inject into the Kg through Eg interval. We
are now injecting into intervals $368-73. 5602•06 (Kg), 5631&32, 563942, 364649 (xp).
5660-62, 5671-75 (Kg), 5687•88, 5702•05, 5712-14 (Ky), 5760, 5767 04, 1777, 5782 (LA).
5791, 5795, 5802, 5811, 5819 (LAale 5827, 5836, 5841, (Lg), $869 (LC) and 5889 (Lo).
The K and L saada are separated by a packer. This is a dual injestion wait.

Prior Injection: 2438 WPD at 1940 pai (L-Lg interval)

Present Injection: 1140 WPD at 10 pst (KB•Kr interval)
1060 WFD at 1900 pai (L-La interval)

18. I hereby cert e s true and correct

SIGNED R. W. PATTERS N TITLE DATg #7

(This space for Federal or State ofBee use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY :

*See Instructionson ReverseSide

USGS, SLC•3; 040CC, SLC-2; Oult, Okla. City-1; Gulf, Casper•1; Caniktas•1; Humble. Denver-1;

2",'dü> L TED STATES sgsh MINr et No. 42-It1424.

DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR verse side)
o. on re-

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY $•ÛÊi

SUNDRYNOTKES AND REPORTSON WELLS
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTES OR TRIBE NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

ELL
SLL

OTHER Water Injection Red Wash
NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FARM OR LEASE NAMB

Chevron 011 Company, Western Division
.

ADDRESS OF OPERATOR A. WEL NO.

P. O. Box 455, Veraal, Utah Batt #148 (13•223)
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10. TIELD AND POOL, OB WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
At surface

660' FM, and 2073.4' PSL of See. 22, T78, R238 11... r.,a.,... BI,K.AND

See. 22. TTS, R238
14. PERMIT No. 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT. GR, etc.) 12, COUNTY OR PARISH 18. STATE

KB • 5687.8 Utstah Utah

16 CheckAppropriate BoxTo Indicate Nature of Notice, Report,or OtherData
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO : SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF :

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TBEAT 3IULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIEING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANs (Other) EU$¾
(NoTE: Report resalts of multiþ1e contpletion on Wel

(Other) Completion or Recognpletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and gones perti-

nent to this work.) *

On 7/26/67 subject well was equipped to inject into the Kg through Eg interval. We
are now injecting into intervals $368-73. 5602•06 (Kg), 5631&32, 563942, 364649 (xp).
5660-62, 5671-75 (Kg), 5687•88, 5702•05, 5712-14 (Ky), 5760, 5767 04, 1777, 5782 (LA).
5791, 5795, 5802, 5811, 5819 (LAale 5827, 5836, 5841, (Lg), $869 (LC) and 5889 (Lo).
The K and L saada are separated by a packer. This is a dual injestion wait.

Prior Injection: 2438 WPD at 1940 pai (L-Lg interval)

Present Injection: 1140 WPD at 10 pst (KB•Kr interval)
1060 WFD at 1900 pai (L-La interval)

18. I hereby cert e s true and correct

SIGNED R. W. PATTERS N TITLE DATg #7

(This space for Federal or State ofBee use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY :

*See Instructionson ReverseSide

USGS, SLC•3; 040CC, SLC-2; Oult, Okla. City-1; Gulf, Casper•1; Caniktas•1; Humble. Denver-1;



Form 9-331 U ¯D STATES SUBMIT IN TRIF ATE. Form approved.
(May 1963) (Other instructionh.,.sh re- Budget Bureau No. 42--R1424.

DEPARTME OF THE INTERIOR yerge side) 6. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY U-DA1

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

j¯¯ ¯

7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
°w'à E. w^="LL

OTH ifater In,1ection _ Red Wash
2. NAME OF NE TO 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

Chevron U.S.A. Inc.
8. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

P. O. Box 599, Denver, Colorado 80201 Unit #148 (13-??B)
4. LOCATlON OF WEIL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
At surface

660' FWL and 2073 FSL (NWhŠW1 11. sain'd'oi'aËŽ AND

14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whether Dr, RT, ca, etc.) 12. couNËT on PAArsH 13. sTATE

KB 5687,8' Uintah . I Utab -

1e· CheckAppropriate BoxTo Indicate Nature of Notice, Repos, or Other Data
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT 07:

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PCLL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF EEPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTUEE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIzz ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIEING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANs (Other)
(NoTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel(Other) Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CO31PLETED OPERATIONS (CÎ€nfly State all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this work.) *

It is proposed to rework this well as follows:

1. MIR and RU. ND tree. NU BOPE. Check meter.
2. Circ. well w/injection H20. POOH w/tbg and LD. RIH pkr and mill over mod "D"

with same.
3. RIH w/bit, csg scraper, and work string to clean out to 5800'. Circ. w/fresh H20.

POOH.
4. RIH w/bridge plug and set at ± 5735'. Dump 5' cmt on top of CIBP.
5. RIH w/pkr, 12 BP and workstring to cmt sqz. Set REP at ± 5300'. and pkr at ±5200'.

Sqz zone w/50 sxs low fluid loss cement to a press of 2000 psi. Pull pkr up. Squeeze
zone w/50 sx cat. POOH.

6. RIH w/bit, esg scraper and workstring to DOC. to ± 5170'. Press test to 2000 psi.
Cire hole clean. POOH. RIH to retrieve RBP. POÕH.

7. RU to perf. POOH w/casing gun.
8. RIH w/RB\ and pkr to acidize, See attached.
9. RIH w/new 2-3/8" tubing. (type TK-69)

10. Establish injection rate down tubing. z. - S ka e

No additional surface
disturbances required

CA e 7 23for this activig. -

18. I bereby cert "at th orego is true and correct

(ÎUS EþiC€ ÎOr Fed€ral Or State office use) '

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructionson Reverse

Form 9-331 U ¯D STATES SUBMIT IN TRIF ATE. Form approved.
(May 1963) (Other instructionh.,.sh re- Budget Bureau No. 42--R1424.

DEPARTME OF THE INTERIOR yerge side) 6. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY U-DA1

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

j¯¯ ¯

7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
°w'à E. w^="LL

OTH ifater In,1ection _ Red Wash
2. NAME OF NE TO 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

Chevron U.S.A. Inc.
8. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

P. O. Box 599, Denver, Colorado 80201 Unit #148 (13-??B)
4. LOCATlON OF WEIL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
At surface

660' FWL and 2073 FSL (NWhŠW1 11. sain'd'oi'aËŽ AND

14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whether Dr, RT, ca, etc.) 12. couNËT on PAArsH 13. sTATE

KB 5687,8' Uintah . I Utab -

1e· CheckAppropriate BoxTo Indicate Nature of Notice, Repos, or Other Data
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT 07:

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PCLL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF EEPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTUEE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIzz ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIEING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANs (Other)
(NoTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel(Other) Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CO31PLETED OPERATIONS (CÎ€nfly State all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this work.) *

It is proposed to rework this well as follows:

1. MIR and RU. ND tree. NU BOPE. Check meter.
2. Circ. well w/injection H20. POOH w/tbg and LD. RIH pkr and mill over mod "D"

with same.
3. RIH w/bit, csg scraper, and work string to clean out to 5800'. Circ. w/fresh H20.

POOH.
4. RIH w/bridge plug and set at ± 5735'. Dump 5' cmt on top of CIBP.
5. RIH w/pkr, 12 BP and workstring to cmt sqz. Set REP at ± 5300'. and pkr at ±5200'.

Sqz zone w/50 sxs low fluid loss cement to a press of 2000 psi. Pull pkr up. Squeeze
zone w/50 sx cat. POOH.

6. RIH w/bit, esg scraper and workstring to DOC. to ± 5170'. Press test to 2000 psi.
Cire hole clean. POOH. RIH to retrieve RBP. POÕH.

7. RU to perf. POOH w/casing gun.
8. RIH w/RB\ and pkr to acidize, See attached.
9. RIH w/new 2-3/8" tubing. (type TK-69)

10. Establish injection rate down tubing. z. - S ka e

No additional surface
disturbances required

CA e 7 23for this activig. -

18. I bereby cert "at th orego is true and correct

(ÎUS EþiC€ ÎOr Fed€ral Or State office use) '

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructionson Reverse



WELL NAME: RWU 148 (13-22¾)

FIELD: Red wash

PROPOSED PERFORATING PROCEDURE

1. Changes intended: Rework

2. Results anticipated: Increase injectivity

3. Conditions of well which warrant such work:

4. To be ripped or shot: shot

5. Depth, number and size of shots (or depth of rips): 3 ejpf

5566-75
7580-84
5597-5607
5629-32
5637-49
5653-62
5669-81
5686-89
5700-14

6. Date last Log of well filed:

7. Anticipated additional surface disturbances: none

8. Estimated work date:
May 20, 1979

9. Present production and status: injection

Date BOPD MCFD BWPD

3/29
tubing 1700 3
tog-esg annulus 7 0 .'ggT

WELL NAME: RWU 148 (13-22¾)

FIELD: Red wash

PROPOSED PERFORATING PROCEDURE

1. Changes intended: Rework

2. Results anticipated: Increase injectivity

3. Conditions of well which warrant such work:

4. To be ripped or shot: shot

5. Depth, number and size of shots (or depth of rips): 3 ejpf

5566-75
7580-84
5597-5607
5629-32
5637-49
5653-62
5669-81
5686-89
5700-14

6. Date last Log of well filed:

7. Anticipated additional surface disturbances: none

8. Estimated work date:
May 20, 1979

9. Present production and status: injection

Date BOPD MCFD BWPD

3/29
tubing 1700 3
tog-esg annulus 7 0 .'ggT



WELL NAEE: RWU 148 (13-228)

FIELD: Red Wash

PROPOSED TREATMENT PROCEDURE

1. Objective: Increase injectivity

2. Size and type of treatment: 3650 gal. 15% HCL

3. Intervals to be treated: 5566-5584, 5597-5607, 5629-5710

4. Treatment down casing or tubing:

5. Method of localizing its effects: 50% benzoic acid flakes - 50% napthalene

6. Disposal of treating fluid: swab back spent acid

7. Name of company to do work: Dowell, Halliburton, or Western

8. Anticipated additional surface disturbances: none

9. Estimated work date: May 20, 1979

10. Present status, current production and producing interval: Injection

Date BOPD MCFD BWPD

3/29 tubing 1700 BWI/h

tbg-esg annulus 700

WELL NAEE: RWU 148 (13-228)

FIELD: Red Wash

PROPOSED TREATMENT PROCEDURE

1. Objective: Increase injectivity

2. Size and type of treatment: 3650 gal. 15% HCL

3. Intervals to be treated: 5566-5584, 5597-5607, 5629-5710

4. Treatment down casing or tubing:

5. Method of localizing its effects: 50% benzoic acid flakes - 50% napthalene

6. Disposal of treating fluid: swab back spent acid

7. Name of company to do work: Dowell, Halliburton, or Western

8. Anticipated additional surface disturbances: none

9. Estimated work date: May 20, 1979

10. Present status, current production and producing interval: Injection

Date BOPD MCFD BWPD

3/29 tubing 1700 BWI/h

tbg-esg annulus 700



'Jy'1¯9
) UUD STATES go,shM nINæT I TE. Fo a y .No. 42-R1424.

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR verse.tae>
" '*¯

f). LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY p_gg

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORT$ON WELLS
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a prent reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposal

1.
OIL GAS

7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

WELL WELL OTHER IAT'31-9T* TT1 Gr f1nn ASh I
2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FARM OB LEASE NAME

Chevron U. S.A. Inc, N or
ADDREss OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

P. O. Box 599 Denver Coloraan 80201 16A (13-??n3
4 CATION OF WELL (Report location clearly 'and in accordance with any Sta ements. 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR ÑILDCAT

See also space 17 below.) \¾
At surface

11. SEC., T., B., M., OR BLE. AND660' FMIL and 2073.4' FSL (NW¼Sw¼) soavar on sama

See- ?? T79 9W
14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whether or, RT, on, etc.) Ì2. COUNTY ÔR PARIBË . BTATE

ITE 56AR Uint,h I TTrab
16 CheckAppropriate BoxTo Indicate Natureof Notice, Report,or OtherData

NOTICE 09 INTENTION TO : SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF :

TEST WATER BRUT-OFF PULL OB ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPI,ETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CABING

SHOOT OR ACIDIE. X ABANDON* BROOTING OR ACIDIEING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)
(NoTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel

(Other) Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form,)
17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this work.) *

It is proposed to cement squeeze, perforate, re-perforate, acidize well, and eliminate
tubing casing annulus injection with a dual string tubing injection as follows:

1. MIR and RU. ND Tree. NU BOPE. Circ well w/injection water. POOH w/tbg and packer.
2. RIH w/bit, casing scraper and workstring. Clean out well to 5,915. POOH.
3. RIH w/CIBP and set at 5735. Dump 5' cmt on top of CIBP.
4. RIH w/packer, RBP & workstring. Cement squeeze perf at 5,242 \«/100 sxs cmt and

perfc at 5155 w/100 sxs cmt. POOH.
5. RIH w/bit, esg. scraper and workstring. Drill out emt and press. test mach squeeze

to 2000 psi. POOH.
6. Perforate. See attached
7. Acidize. See attached.
8. POOH w/BPP and packer.
9. RIH w/2-3/8" plastic coated Dual String tbg, A-5 Hydrostatic Dual packer, set at 5,550

and model FH Hydrostatic packer set at 5618.
10. Place well on production.

3- USGS 1- JCB
No additional surface 2- State 1- Sec 723
disturbances required 3- Partners 1- DLD
for †.his activi'J., 1- File

18. I hereby certify that the f egoing is true and correct

SIGNED TITLE Engineering Assistant says May 14, 1979

(This space for Federal or State ofBee use)

APPROVED BY TITLE y)
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY: APPkuveu BŸfHE DIVISIONOF

OiL, GAS, AND MINING
DATE:Á"/S- 2*SeeInstructionson Reverse

'Jy'1¯9
) UUD STATES go,shM nINæT I TE. Fo a y .No. 42-R1424.

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR verse.tae>
" '*¯

f). LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY p_gg

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORT$ON WELLS
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a prent reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposal

1.
OIL GAS

7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

WELL WELL OTHER IAT'31-9T*
TT1 Gr f1nn ASh I

2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FARM OB LEASE NAME

Chevron U. S.A. Inc, N or
ADDREss OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

P. O. Box 599 Denver Coloraan 80201 16A (13-??n3
4 CATION OF WELL (Report location clearly 'and in accordance with any Sta ements. 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR ÑILDCAT

See also space 17 below.) \¾
At surface

11. SEC., T., B., M., OR BLE. AND660' FMIL and 2073.4' FSL (NW¼Sw¼) soavar on sama

See- ?? T79 9W
14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whether or, RT, on, etc.) Ì2. COUNTY ÔR PARIBË . BTATE

ITE 56AR Uint,h I TTrab
16 CheckAppropriate BoxTo Indicate Natureof Notice, Report,or OtherData

NOTICE 09 INTENTION TO : SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF :

TEST WATER BRUT-OFF PULL OB ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPI,ETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CABING

SHOOT OR ACIDIE. X ABANDON* BROOTING OR ACIDIEING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)
(NoTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel

(Other) Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form,)
17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this work.) *

It is proposed to cement squeeze, perforate, re-perforate, acidize well, and eliminate
tubing casing annulus injection with a dual string tubing injection as follows:

1. MIR and RU. ND Tree. NU BOPE. Circ well w/injection water. POOH w/tbg and packer.
2. RIH w/bit, casing scraper and workstring. Clean out well to 5,915. POOH.
3. RIH w/CIBP and set at 5735. Dump 5' cmt on top of CIBP.
4. RIH w/packer, RBP & workstring. Cement squeeze perf at 5,242 \«/100 sxs cmt and

perfc at 5155 w/100 sxs cmt. POOH.
5. RIH w/bit, esg. scraper and workstring. Drill out emt and press. test mach squeeze

to 2000 psi. POOH.
6. Perforate. See attached
7. Acidize. See attached.
8. POOH w/BPP and packer.
9. RIH w/2-3/8" plastic coated Dual String tbg, A-5 Hydrostatic Dual packer, set at 5,550

and model FH Hydrostatic packer set at 5618.
10. Place well on production.

3- USGS 1- JCB
No additional surface 2- State 1- Sec 723
disturbances required 3- Partners 1- DLD
for †.his activi'J., 1- File

18. I hereby certify that the f egoing is true and correct

SIGNED TITLE Engineering Assistant says May 14, 1979

(This space for Federal or State ofBee use)

APPROVED BY TITLE y)
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY: APPkuveu BŸfHE DIVISIONOF

OiL, GAS, AND MINING
DATE:Á"/S- 2*SeeInstructionson Reverse



WELL NANE: RWU 148 (13-223)

FIELD: Red Wash

PROPOSED PERFORATING PROCEDURE

1. Changes intended: Open new sands to water injection

2. Results anticipated: Increased rate of water injection

3. Conditions of well which warrant such work:

4. To be ripped or shot:
shot

5. Depth, number and size of shots (or depth of rips): 3 shots/ft

5566-75 5653-55 -

5580-84 5659-62
5597-98 5669-81
5601-07 5686-89
5629-32 5700-06
5637-42 5709-14
5644-49

6. .Date last Log of well filed:

7. Anticipated additional surface disturbances: None

8. Estimated work date: June 1, 1979

9. Present production and status:

Date BOPD MCFD BWPD
downtubing

958 casing annulus
3/79

3/79 641 Down

WELL NANE: RWU 148 (13-223)

FIELD: Red Wash

PROPOSED PERFORATING PROCEDURE

1. Changes intended: Open new sands to water injection

2. Results anticipated: Increased rate of water injection

3. Conditions of well which warrant such work:

4. To be ripped or shot:
shot

5. Depth, number and size of shots (or depth of rips): 3 shots/ft

5566-75 5653-55 -

5580-84 5659-62
5597-98 5669-81
5601-07 5686-89
5629-32 5700-06
5637-42 5709-14
5644-49

6. .Date last Log of well filed:

7. Anticipated additional surface disturbances: None

8. Estimated work date: June 1, 1979

9. Present production and status:

Date BOPD MCFD BWPD
downtubing

958 casing annulus
3/79

3/79 641 Down



WELL NAEE: RWU 148 (13-228)

FIELD: Red Wash

PROPOSED TREATMENT PROCEDURE

1. Objective: Increase water injection rate

2. Size and type of treatment: 5566-84 500 gal 15% HCL
5597-5607 300 gal 15% HCL
5629-5714 2850 gal 15% HCL

3. Intervals to be treated:

4. Treatment down casing or tubing: tubing

5. Method of localizing its effects: Retrievable Bridge Plug, packer and 750#
of benzoic acid flakes - napthalene to be used as diverting agents,

6..--Disposal of treating fluid: spent acid will be swabbed back to flat tank

7. Name of company to do work: Dowell, Halliburton or Western

8. Anticipated additional surface disturbances: None

9. Estimated work date: June 2, 1979

10. Present status, current production and producing interval: Injecting

Date BOPD MCFD BWPD down tubing -

3/79 958 casing down annulus

3/79 641 down

WELL NAEE: RWU 148 (13-228)

FIELD: Red Wash

PROPOSED TREATMENT PROCEDURE

1. Objective: Increase water injection rate

2. Size and type of treatment: 5566-84 500 gal 15% HCL
5597-5607 300 gal 15% HCL
5629-5714 2850 gal 15% HCL

3. Intervals to be treated:

4. Treatment down casing or tubing: tubing

5. Method of localizing its effects: Retrievable Bridge Plug, packer and 750#
of benzoic acid flakes - napthalene to be used as diverting agents,

6..--Disposal of treating fluid: spent acid will be swabbed back to flat tank

7. Name of company to do work: Dowell, Halliburton or Western

8. Anticipated additional surface disturbances: None

9. Estimated work date: June 2, 1979

10. Present status, current production and producing interval: Injecting

Date BOPD MCFD BWPD down tubing -

3/79 958 casing down annulus

3/79 641 down



Form 331 Form Approved.
Dec. 1973 Budget Bureau No. 42-R1424

UNITED STATES 5. LEASE
DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR U-081

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME -

Red wash(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different
reservoir. Use Form 9-331-C for such proposals.) 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

1. oil gas
well well other Water Injection 9. WELL NO.

2. NAME OF OPERATOR 148 (13-223)
Chevron U. S. A. Inc. 10. FIELDOR WILDCAT NAME

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR Red Wash
P. O. Box 599, Denver, CO 80201 11. SEC., T., R., M., OR BLK. AND SURVEY OR

4. LOCATION OF WELL (REPORT LOCATION CLEARLY. See space 17 AREA
below.) Sec. 22, T7S, R23E
AT SURFACE: 660' FWI, & 2073' FSL (NW¾ Syg) 12. CouNTYOR PARISH 13. STATE
AT TOP PROD. INTERVAL: Uintah UtahAT TOTALDEPTH:

14. API NO.
16. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE,

REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 15. ELEVATIONS (SHOW DF, KDB, AND WD)
KB 5688REQUEST FOR APPROVAL TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF
FRACTURE TREAT
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE O El
REPAIR WELL (NOTE: Report results of multiple completion or zone
PULL OR ALTER CASING change on Form 9-330.)
MULTIPLE COMPLETE
CHANGE ZONES
ABANDON*

* (other)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates,
including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and
measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Well was cmt sqzd, perforated and acidized as follows:

1. MI & RU. 3 - Uses
2. POOH w/2-7/8" tbg. 2 - State -

3. RIH & mill out Mod D pkr. 3 - Partners
4. Set CIBP at 5735• 1 - JCB
5. Sqzd perf 5242 & 5155 w/100 sx each. 1 - Sec 723
6. RIH & drilled cmt & tested same. 1 - File
7. Perforated. See attached.
8. Acidized. See attached.
9. RIH w/new 2-3/8" tbg. No adC 1 :.a Joe
10. RD & MO. disturbancos requirod
11. Placed well on injection. Sca•.t.his notaTîi

Subsurface Safety Valve: Manu. and Type Ft.

18. I he fy that the foregoi lis true and correct

SIGNED ZZ TITLE Engineering Asst. onze Dec. 17 1979
(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE . DATE
CONOITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See instructions on Reverse Side . ws...
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FRACTURE TREAT
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE O El
REPAIR WELL (NOTE: Report results of multiple completion or zone
PULL OR ALTER CASING change on Form 9-330.)
MULTIPLE COMPLETE
CHANGE ZONES
ABANDON*

* (other)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates,
including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and
measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Well was cmt sqzd, perforated and acidized as follows:

1. MI & RU. 3 - Uses
2. POOH w/2-7/8" tbg. 2 - State -

3. RIH & mill out Mod D pkr. 3 - Partners
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APPROVED BY TITLE . DATE
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*See instructions on Reverse Side . ws...



WELL NAME 148 (13-223)

FIELD NAME Red Wash

COMPLETED TREATMENTPROCEDURE

1. Size and type of treatment: 3650 gal, 15Z HCL.

2. Intervals treated: 5629-5714, 5597-5607, 5566-5584.

3. Treatment down casing or tubin8- Tubing,

4. Methods used to localize effects:Benzoic acid flakes & Napthalene.

5. Disposal of treating fluid: Spent acid was swabbed back.

6. Depth to which well was cleaned out:

7. Time spent bailing and cleaning out:

8. Date of work: 9/17/79.

9. Company who performed work: Dowell.

10. Production interval: 5629-5714, 5597-5607, 5566-5584.

11. Status and production before treatment:

Date BOPD MCFD BWPD

3/79 958 tbg-esg annulus

641 tbg

12. Status and production after treatment:

Date BOPD MCFD BWPD

10/79 1,268 tbg-esg annulus

43

WELL NAME 148 (13-223)

FIELD NAME Red Wash

COMPLETED TREATMENTPROCEDURE

1. Size and type of treatment: 3650 gal, 15Z HCL.

2. Intervals treated: 5629-5714, 5597-5607, 5566-5584.

3. Treatment down casing or tubin8- Tubing,

4. Methods used to localize effects:Benzoic acid flakes & Napthalene.

5. Disposal of treating fluid: Spent acid was swabbed back.

6. Depth to which well was cleaned out:

7. Time spent bailing and cleaning out:

8. Date of work: 9/17/79.

9. Company who performed work: Dowell.

10. Production interval: 5629-5714, 5597-5607, 5566-5584.

11. Status and production before treatment:

Date BOPD MCFD BWPD

3/79 958 tbg-esg annulus

641 tbg

12. Status and production after treatment:

Date BOPD MCFD BWPD

10/79 1,268 tbg-esg annulus

43



ELL NAME: 148 (13-22B)

FIELD: Red Wash

COMPLETED PERFORATING PROCEDURE

1. Depth, number and size of shots (or depths of rips): 3 CJPF

5566-75
5580-84
5597-5607
5629-32
5637-49
5653-62
5669-81
5686-89
5700-14

2. Company doing work: Oil Rell Perforators.

3. Date of work: 9-16-79.

4. Additional surface distrubances: None.

5. Production after work:

Date BOPD MCFD BWPD

10/79 1,268 tbg-cag annulus

43 tbg

JAM

ELL NAME: 148 (13-22B)

FIELD: Red Wash

COMPLETED PERFORATING PROCEDURE

1. Depth, number and size of shots (or depths of rips): 3 CJPF

5566-75
5580-84
5597-5607
5629-32
5637-49
5653-62
5669-81
5686-89
5700-14

2. Company doing work: Oil Rell Perforators.

3. Date of work: 9-16-79.

4. Additional surface distrubances: None.

5. Production after work:

Date BOPD MCFD BWPD

10/79 1,268 tbg-cag annulus

43 tbg

JAM



Form 9-331 Form Approved.
* Dec. 1973 Budget Bureau No. 42-RI424

UNITED STATES 5. LEASE
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR U-081

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
Red Wash

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different
reservoir. Use Form 9-331-C for such proposals.) 8. FARM OR LEASENAME

1. oil O " Owell well other Water Injection 9. WELL NO.

1 NAME OF OPERATOR 148 (13-228)
CHEVRON U. S.A. INC. 10. FIELD OR WILDCAT NAME

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR
P. O. BOX 599, DENVER, CO 80201 11. SEC., T., R., M., OR BLK. AND SURVEY OR

4. LOCATION OF WELL (REPORT LOCATION CLEARLY. See space 17 AREA
below.) S22, T7S, R23E
AT SURFACE: 660'FWL & 2073'FSL (NW SW) 12. COUNTYORPARISH 13. STATE
AT TOP PROD. INTERVAL: Uintah Utah
AT TOTAL DEPTH:

14. API NO.
16. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE,

REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 15. ELEVATIONS (SHOW DF, KDB, AND WD)
KB 5688

REQUEST FOR APPROVAL TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:
TEST WATER SHUT-OFF
FRACTURE TREAT
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE
REPAIR WELL (NOTE: Report results of multiple completion or zone
PULL OR ALTER CASING change on Porm 9-330.)
MULTIPLECOMPLETE
CHANGE ZONES
ABANDON*
(other)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates,
including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and
measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

It is proposed to acidize this well as per attached procedure.

3-USGS
2-State
3-Partners
1-Field Foreman

llo addttio-Al surggµ¡o 1-Sec. 723
distur%anoes reggiset 1-File

Subsurface Safety Valve: Manu. and Type __ Set g , Ft.

18. I hereby ce y that the forego ng is tru and correct

SIGNED . .. TITirEngineering Assist•DATE October 19, 1981
(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

APPROVEDW TA STATE
OF UTAH Divigt0N OF
01E, GAS,ANDMINING

*See instructions en Reverse Side DATE:

Form 9-331 Form Approved.
* Dec. 1973 Budget Bureau No. 42-RI424

UNITED STATES 5. LEASE
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR U-081

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
Red Wash

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different
reservoir. Use Form 9-331-C for such proposals.) 8. FARM OR LEASENAME

1. oil O " Owell well other Water Injection 9. WELL NO.

1 NAME OF OPERATOR 148 (13-228)
CHEVRON U. S.A. INC. 10. FIELD OR WILDCAT NAME

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR
P. O. BOX 599, DENVER, CO 80201 11. SEC., T., R., M., OR BLK. AND SURVEY OR

4. LOCATION OF WELL (REPORT LOCATION CLEARLY. See space 17 AREA

below.) S22, T7S, R23E
AT SURFACE: 660'FWL & 2073'FSL (NW SW) 12. COUNTYORPARISH 13. STATE
AT TOP PROD. INTERVAL: Uintah Utah
AT TOTAL DEPTH:

14. API NO.
16. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE,

REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 15. ELEVATIONS (SHOW DF, KDB, AND WD)
KB 5688

REQUEST FOR APPROVAL TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:
TEST WATER SHUT-OFF
FRACTURE TREAT
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE
REPAIR WELL (NOTE: Report results of multiple completion or zone
PULL OR ALTER CASING change on Porm 9-330.)
MULTIPLECOMPLETE
CHANGE ZONES
ABANDON*
(other)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates,
including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and
measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

It is proposed to acidize this well as per attached procedure.

3-USGS
2-State
3-Partners
1-Field Foreman

llo addttio-Al surggµ¡o 1-Sec. 723
distur%anoes reggiset 1-File

Subsurface Safety Valve: Manu. and Type __ Set g , Ft.

18. I hereby ce y that the forego ng is tru and correct

SIGNED . .. TITirEngineering Assist•DATE October 19, 1981
(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

APPROVEDW TA STATE
OF UTAH Divigt0N OF
01E, GAS,ANDMINING

*See instructions en Reverse Side DATE:



APPROVEDBYTHE DIVISION
OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

WELL NAME: 148 (13-22B) ()AffË¾
FIELD: Red Wash ElY.

PROPOSED TREATMENTPROCEDURE

1. Objective: Acidize well to remove scale deposits.

2. Size and type of treatment: 3,000 gal MOD-202 acid.

3. Intervals to be treated:

Short String (5566-5607) - 1500 gallons acid
Long String (5629-5714) - 1500 gallons acid

4. Treatment down casing or tubing: Tubing

5. Method of localizing its effects: 2% KC1

6. Disposal of treating fluid: Flow spent acid to frac tank.

7. Name of company to do work: Halliburton, Dowell or Western

8. Anticipated additional surface disturbances: None

9. Estimated work date: 11/1/81

10. Present status, current production and producing interval:

Date BOPD MCFD BWPD

9/81 Injecting 1000 EwPD at 2000 psi into long string.
Injecting 1100 BWPD at 2500 psi into short

APPROVEDBYTHE DIVISION
OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

WELL NAME: 148 (13-22B) ()AffË¾
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PROPOSED TREATMENTPROCEDURE
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6. Disposal of treating fluid: Flow spent acid to frac tank.

7. Name of company to do work: Halliburton, Dowell or Western

8. Anticipated additional surface disturbances: None

9. Estimated work date: 11/1/81

10. Present status, current production and producing interval:

Date BOPD MCFD BWPD

9/81 Injecting 1000 EwPD at 2000 psi into long string.
Injecting 1100 BWPD at 2500 psi into short



RWU #148 (13-223)
October 12, 1981
Page 2

Portinent Data:

KB - 5688'
PBTD - 5735' (CIßP)
7" 23#/ft J-55 casing set at 5935'

Tubing Detail (9-21-79):

Long Short
KB 11.00 KB 11.00hanger .87 hanger .87pup jt. 10.00 170 jts. P.L. 2-3/8" tbg. 5461.03178 jts. P.L. 2-3/8" tbg. 5452.89 seal assembly 6.60Model A-5 packer 9.95 5479.504 jts. P. T.. 2-3/8" tbg. 125.70
Model FH packer 6.65
pup jt. 6.23
"F" nipple

.95

trip sub 1.18
5625.42

Perforations:

5566-75 (K 20-50) 5629-32 (KD 00-20) 5669-81 (KE 30-99)
5580-84 (K 70-90) 5637-49 (KD 20-40) 5686-89 (KF 00-10)
5597-5607 (KC 00-40) 5653-62 (KE 00-10) 5700-14 (KF 30-70)

Procedure:

1. RU. Move in pumping equipment to acidize down the individual tubing strings.Use MOD-202 acid with 1 gal/1000 Para-sperse paraffin cleaner, 2 gal/1000HAI-55 corrosion inhibitor and 25 lb/1000 FE-2 iron sequestering agent(Halliburton products-may use equivalent). Overflush acid to formation with2% KCl water. Backflow acid load from each string and continue to backflow
until well cleans up.

a) Short string (5566-5607) - Pump 1500 gallons acid.
b) Long string (5629-5714) - Pump 1500 gallons acid.

2. Place well back on

RWU #148 (13-223)
October 12, 1981
Page 2

Portinent Data:

KB - 5688'
PBTD - 5735' (CIßP)
7" 23#/ft J-55 casing set at 5935'

Tubing Detail (9-21-79):

Long Short
KB 11.00 KB 11.00hanger .87 hanger .87pup jt. 10.00 170 jts. P.L. 2-3/8" tbg. 5461.03178 jts. P.L. 2-3/8" tbg. 5452.89 seal assembly 6.60Model A-5 packer 9.95 5479.504 jts. P. T.. 2-3/8" tbg. 125.70
Model FH packer 6.65
pup jt. 6.23
"F" nipple

.95

trip sub 1.18
5625.42

Perforations:

5566-75 (K 20-50) 5629-32 (KD 00-20) 5669-81 (KE 30-99)
5580-84 (K 70-90) 5637-49 (KD 20-40) 5686-89 (KF 00-10)
5597-5607 (KC 00-40) 5653-62 (KE 00-10) 5700-14 (KF 30-70)

Procedure:

1. RU. Move in pumping equipment to acidize down the individual tubing strings.Use MOD-202 acid with 1 gal/1000 Para-sperse paraffin cleaner, 2 gal/1000HAI-55 corrosion inhibitor and 25 lb/1000 FE-2 iron sequestering agent(Halliburton products-may use equivalent). Overflush acid to formation with2% KCl water. Backflow acid load from each string and continue to backflow
until well cleans up.

a) Short string (5566-5607) - Pump 1500 gallons acid.
b) Long string (5629-5714) - Pump 1500 gallons acid.

2. Place well back on



FORMDOGM-UIC10
May 1983 --/

--^

STATEOF UTAH
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS ANDMINING

4241 State Office Building
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114

WELLINTEGRITY REPORT

DATE: COMPANY/0PERATOR

Water Disposal Well
____

Enhanced Recovery Well ) Other

API Well Number 43-Öf'7- / ¶o2/o Lease-Jiame/-Number

SEC. cŸÊ TOWNSHIP $ RANGEo?3 WELLNAME/NUMBER /

Lease Name/Number - OŸ/ LocationÑÙ1/4 of 1/4 COUNTY:

* * * *

INITIAL CONDITIONS:

Long string Rate/Pressure: e 'd>/d] bw/d c Acá i~d] psi

Short String Rate/Pressure: $7/><] bw/d C
ecQ,¶~~

psi
Csg-tbg Annulus Pressure: íÎl psi

CONDITIONSDURINGTEST:

Long string Pressure: (ef() psi /O Minutes Time: /ay/p to //, /p
Short string Pressure

¿pg3~'
psi /O Minutes

Csg-tbg Annulus Pressure />dd(3 Psi

Amount of water added to annulus: ci?d5 bb1s

AFTER ANNULUSBLEEDOFF:

Long string Pressure:
Ñ/oS~O psi

Short string Pressure: c?£c2 psi
Csg-tbg Annulu Pressure: -4 psi

0 p a (Name)

UIC FIELD lÑSPELIO

FORMDOGM-UIC10
May 1983 --/

--^

STATEOF UTAH
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS ANDMINING

4241 State Office Building
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114

WELLINTEGRITY REPORT

DATE: COMPANY/0PERATOR

Water Disposal Well
____

Enhanced Recovery Well ) Other

API Well Number 43-Öf'7- / ¶o2/o Lease-Jiame/-Number

SEC. cŸÊ TOWNSHIP $ RANGEo?3 WELLNAME/NUMBER /

Lease Name/Number - OŸ/ LocationÑÙ1/4 of 1/4 COUNTY:

* * * *

INITIAL CONDITIONS:

Long string Rate/Pressure: e 'd>/d] bw/d c Acá i~d]
psi

Short String Rate/Pressure: $7/><] bw/d C
ecQ,¶~~

psi
Csg-tbg Annulus Pressure: íÎl psi

CONDITIONSDURINGTEST:

Long string Pressure: (ef() psi /O Minutes Time: /ay/p to //, /p
Short string Pressure

¿pg3~'
psi /O Minutes

Csg-tbg Annulus Pressure />dd(3 Psi

Amount of water added to annulus: ci?d5 bb1s

AFTER ANNULUSBLEEDOFF:

Long string Pressure:
Ñ/oS~O

psi
Short string Pressure: c?£c2 psi
Csg-tbg Annulu Pressure: -4 psi

0 p a (Name)

UIC FIELD lÑSPELIO



CHECKLIST FOR IN3ECTION WELL APPLICATION AND FILE REVIEW

Operator: Well No. /3-2..~L/3 /Aff'

County: T ? 5 R 3 Sec. 2- API# ¿,/3- fly f-70 M/

New Well Conversion A/'Disposal Well Enhanced Recovery Well 6

YES NO

UIC Forms Completed &

Plat including Surface Owners, Leaseholders,
and wells of available record

Schematic Diagram

Fracture Information

Pressure and Rate Control

Adequate Geologic Information

Fluid Source

Analysis of Injection Fluid Yes C- No TOS diy¢Úl
Analysis of Water in Formation Yes ¿,---No TDS 2./,442

to be injected into

Known USDW in area Depth 12dÚ
Number of wells in area of review $2 Prod. P&A O

Water Inj. /
Aquifer Exemption Yes Le '

NA

Mechanical Integrity Test Yes ' No

Date /243 Type //-'O MV IN

Reviewed

CHECKLIST FOR IN3ECTION WELL APPLICATION AND FILE REVIEW

Operator: Well No. /3-2..~L/3 /Aff'

County: T ? 5 R 3 Sec. 2- API# ¿,/3- fly f-70 M/

New Well Conversion A/'Disposal Well Enhanced Recovery Well 6

YES NO

UIC Forms Completed &

Plat including Surface Owners, Leaseholders,
and wells of available record

Schematic Diagram

Fracture Information

Pressure and Rate Control

Adequate Geologic Information

Fluid Source

Analysis of Injection Fluid Yes C- No TOS diy¢Úl
Analysis of Water in Formation Yes ¿,---No TDS 2./,442

to be injected into

Known USDW in area Depth 12dÚ
Number of wells in area of review $2 Prod. P&A O

Water Inj. /
Aquifer Exemption Yes Le '

NA

Mechanical Integrity Test Yes ' No

Date /243 Type //-'O MV IN

Reviewed



Form 9-331 Form Approved.

Dec. 1973 Budget Bureau No. 42-R14 4

UNITED STATES 5. LEASE

DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR U-081

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAME

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

(Do not use this form for pro sais to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different Red Wash
reservoir. Use Form 9-331-C r such proposals.) 8. FARM OR LEASENAME

1. odii O fe'i O other Water Injection 9. WELL NO.

2. NAME OF OPERATOR 148 (13-228)

Chevron U.S.A. Inc. 10. FIELD OR WILDCAT NAME

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR Red Wash

P. O. Box 599, Denver, CO 80201 11. SEC., T., R., M., OR BLK. AND SURVEY OR

4. LOCATION OF WELL (REPORT LOCATION CLEARLY. See space 17 AREA

below.) Sec. 22, T7S, R23E
AT SURFACE: 660' FWL & 2073' FSL NWSW 12. COUNTYORPARISH 13. STATE
AT TOP PROD. INTERVAL: Uintah Utah
AT TOTAL DEPTH: 14. API NO.

16. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE,
REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 15. ELEVATIONS(SHOW DF, KDB, AND WD)

KB 5688 '
,

REQUEST FOR APPROVAL TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF
FRACTURE TREAT
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE
REPAIR WELL (NOTE: Report results of multiple completion or zone

PULL OR ALTER CASING change on Form 9-330.)

MULTIPLE COMPLETE
CHANGE ZONES
ABANDON*
(other)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS(Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates,
including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and
measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

WellMara n<acridizepd pasm

i ipment.
2. Acidized well. See attached.

3. RD pumping equipment.
4. Placed well on injection. 3-BÙi

.

Jis urbances required
1-LJT

for this activi Ly.
1-File

Subsurface Safety Valve: Manu. and Type _ _ _ __ Set @ Ft.

18. I hereby certify t t the foregoing is true and correct

SIGNED TITLE -

Engineering Asst.DATE July 19, 1983

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse

Form 9-331 Form Approved.

Dec. 1973 Budget Bureau No. 42-R14 4

UNITED STATES 5. LEASE

DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR U-081

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAME

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

(Do not use this form for pro sais to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different Red Wash
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Chevron U.S.A. Inc. 10. FIELD OR WILDCAT NAME
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AT TOP PROD. INTERVAL: Uintah Utah
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16. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE,
REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 15. ELEVATIONS(SHOW DF, KDB, AND WD)

KB 5688 '
,

REQUEST FOR APPROVAL TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF
FRACTURE TREAT
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE
REPAIR WELL (NOTE: Report results of multiple completion or zone

PULL OR ALTER CASING change on Form 9-330.)

MULTIPLE COMPLETE
CHANGE ZONES
ABANDON*
(other)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS(Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates,
including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and
measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

WellMara n<acridizepd pasm

i ipment.
2. Acidized well. See attached.

3. RD pumping equipment.
4. Placed well on injection. 3-BÙi

.

Jis urbances required
1-LJT

for this activi Ly.
1-File

Subsurface Safety Valve: Manu. and Type _ _ _ __ Set @ Ft.

18. I hereby certify t t the foregoing is true and correct

SIGNED TITLE -

Engineering Asst.DATE July 19, 1983

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse



WELLNAME' RWU 148 (13-22B)

FIELD NAME Red Wash

COMRLETEDTREATMENTPROCEDURE

1. Size and type of treatment: 4410 gals 15% HCl

2. Intervals treated: 5566 - 5607
5629 - 5714

3. Treatment down casing or tubing: Tubing

4. Methods used to localize effects: Parker settings at 5625 and 5610.

5. Disposal of treating fluid:

6. Depth to which well was cleaned out:

7. Date of work: october 15, 1981

8. Company who performed work: Dowe11

9. Production interval:

10. Status and production before treatment:

Date 80PD MCFD BWPD Injecting

9/81
1,000 Long String
1,100 Short String

11. Status and production after treatment:

Date 80PD MCFD BWPD Injecting

11 & 12/81 1P 0 Long String

1 & 2/82 0 Short String

3/82 310 Long String
964 Short

WELLNAME' RWU 148 (13-22B)

FIELD NAME Red Wash

COMRLETEDTREATMENTPROCEDURE

1. Size and type of treatment: 4410 gals 15% HCl

2. Intervals treated: 5566 - 5607
5629 - 5714

3. Treatment down casing or tubing: Tubing

4. Methods used to localize effects: Parker settings at 5625 and 5610.

5. Disposal of treating fluid:

6. Depth to which well was cleaned out:

7. Date of work: october 15, 1981

8. Company who performed work: Dowe11

9. Production interval:

10. Status and production before treatment:

Date 80PD MCFD BWPD Injecting

9/81
1,000 Long String
1,100 Short String

11. Status and production after treatment:

Date 80PD MCFD BWPD Injecting

11 & 12/81 1P 0 Long String

1 & 2/82 0 Short String

3/82 310 Long String
964 Short



STATEOF UTAH
DIVISION OF OIL,GAS, ANDMINING
ROOM 4241 STATEOFFICEBUILDING

FORM NO. DOGM-UIC-1 SALTLAKECITY,UTAH 84114
(801) 533-5771

(RULE1-5)

IN THE MATTER OF THE APPLICATION OF
Chevron U. S.A. Inc• CAUSENO.

ADDRESS P. O. Box 599
Denver, CO ZIP 80201 ENHANCEDRECOVERY INJ. WELL I

.

DISPOSALWELL O ·

INDIVIDUAt PARTNERSHIP CORPORTATION.l...
FOR ADMINISTRATIVEAPPROVAL TO DISPOSEOR
INJECTFLUIDINTO THE ...RNU...No...lé.8........... WELL
SEC. 22 TWP. 78 RANGE ?SF

Ilintah COUNTY, UTAH

APPLICATION

Comes now the applicant and shows the Division the following:
1. That Rule 1 -5 (b) 6 authorizes administrative approval of enhanced recovery injections or disposal
operations.
2. That the applicant submits the following information.

Lease Name Well No. Field County

11-081 |148 (13-228) Red Wash Uintah
Location of Enhanced Recovery
injection or Disposal Well WŸ SW¾ s... O Twp. 78 Rge. MF

New Well To Be Drilled Old Well To Be Converted Casing Test
Yes O No Yes O No B Yes @ No O Date

Depth-Base Lowest Known Does in¡ection zoneContain State What
Fresh Water Within ½ Mile 2700 Oil-Gagresh Water Within ½ Mile YES U NO O Oil & gas
Location of Either Green River water or Geologic Name(s)
In¡ection Source(s) produced water and Depth of Source(s) Green River 4500-5800

eologic Name of Depth of injection
ion Zone Green River Interv.! 5566 r. 57¼

a. Top of the Perforated Interval:
5566

resh Water: e. Intervening Thickness (a minus b)
2866

intervening thickness sufficient to show fresh water will be tected
without additional dato? YES NO

ogy of Intervening Zones sand-shale
en Rotes and Pressures

Maximum= 2500 B/D. Working = 800 ain
Maximum= 3000 psi, Working = 2000 ps:

The Names and Addresses of Those To Whom Copies of This Application and Attachments Have Been Sent

RJLry.au of Land Management. State of Henh

1400_ University ,Club Building )]!
1.3Á.F99t Sonth Temple
SJ. Lake City, Utah 84111 D¡VBjf

Stasa ng Colorado OIL,GAS & ' e
Applicant

c...,y .f Denver
. ËLC i b

(~J~'
Before me, the unde¢sig uthority, on this day personally appeared

known to me to be the persoss se nome is subscribed to the above instrument, who being by me duly sworn on oath states, that he is duly
.

outhorized to make the above report and that he has knowledge of the facts stated therein, and that said report is true and correct.

Suscribed and s rn to before me this ay of , 19

oloradoBlvd.
My copimis ex ri Notary Public in and for

STATEOF UTAH
DIVISION OF OIL,GAS, ANDMINING
ROOM 4241 STATEOFFICEBUILDING

FORM NO. DOGM-UIC-1 SALTLAKECITY,UTAH 84114
(801) 533-5771

(RULE1-5)
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ADDRESS P. O. Box 599
Denver, CO ZIP 80201 ENHANCEDRECOVERY INJ. WELL I

.
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.
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Suscribed and s rn to before me this ay of , 19

oloradoBlvd.
My copimis ex ri Notary Public in and for



FORM DOGM-U1C-1(continued) INSTRUCTIONS
,

1. Attach qualitative and quantitative analysis of fresh water from 2 or more producing wells
within 1 mile of injection well showing location of wells and date samples were taken, or statement as to
why samples were not submitted.

2. Attach qualitative and quantitative analysis of representative sample of water to be injected.
3. Attach plat showing subject well and all known oil and gas wells, abandoned, drilling and dry

holes within ½ mile, together and with name of operator.
4. Attach Drillers Log (Form DOGM-UIC-2). (Appropriate Surety must be on file with Conserva-

tion Division.)
5. Attach Electric or Radioactivity Log of Sub¡ect well (if released).
6. Attach schematic drawing of subsurface facilities including; Size, setting depth, amount of

cement used measured or calculated topsof cement surface, intermediate (if any) and production casings;
size and setting depth of tubing; type and setting depth of packer; geologic name of injection zone
showing top and bottom of injection interval.

7. The original and 6 copies of application, and one complete set of attachments shall be mailed
to the Division.

8. Deliver 1 copy of application to landowner on whose land in¡ection well is located and to each
operator of a producing loosehold within ½ mile of injection well.

9. Affidavit of mailing or delivery shall be filed not later than five days after the application is

10. Notice that an application has been filed shall be published by the Division in a newspaper of
general circulation in the county in which the well is located. The Division shall file proof of publication
before the application is approved. The notice shall include name and address of opplicant, location of
proposed injection or disposal well, injection zone, injection pressure and volume. If no written objection is
received within 15 days from date of publication the application will be approved administratively.

11. A well shall not be used for injection or disposal unless completed machine accounting Form
DOGM-UIC-3b is filed September 1st, each year.

12. Approval of this application, if granted, is valid only as long as there is no substantial change
in the operations set forth in the application. A substantial operation change requires the approval of a
new application.

13. If there is less intervening thickness required by Rule I-5 (b) 4 attach sworn evidence and data.

CASING ANDTUBINGDATA

NAME OF STRING SIZE SETTING SACKS TOP OF TOP DETERMINED
DEPTH CEMENT CEMENT BY

Surface
10-3(4" 223 160 surface returns

Intermediate

Production 7" 5935 400 4290 calculated

Tubing 2-3/8" 5480, 5625 Baker
ModNeam

4 5,
aËrPa kHerpkr @ 5610

Total Depth Geologic Name - Inj. Zone Depth - Top of In|. Interval Depth - Base of Inj. Interval
5936 Green River 5566 5714

FORM DOGM-U1C-1(continued) INSTRUCTIONS
,

1. Attach qualitative and quantitative analysis of fresh water from 2 or more producing wells
within 1 mile of injection well showing location of wells and date samples were taken, or statement as to
why samples were not submitted.

2. Attach qualitative and quantitative analysis of representative sample of water to be injected.
3. Attach plat showing subject well and all known oil and gas wells, abandoned, drilling and dry

holes within ½ mile, together and with name of operator.
4. Attach Drillers Log (Form DOGM-UIC-2). (Appropriate Surety must be on file with Conserva-

tion Division.)
5. Attach Electric or Radioactivity Log of Sub¡ect well (if released).
6. Attach schematic drawing of subsurface facilities including; Size, setting depth, amount of

cement used measured or calculated topsof cement surface, intermediate (if any) and production casings;
size and setting depth of tubing; type and setting depth of packer; geologic name of injection zone
showing top and bottom of injection interval.

7. The original and 6 copies of application, and one complete set of attachments shall be mailed
to the Division.

8. Deliver 1 copy of application to landowner on whose land in¡ection well is located and to each
operator of a producing loosehold within ½ mile of injection well.

9. Affidavit of mailing or delivery shall be filed not later than five days after the application is

10. Notice that an application has been filed shall be published by the Division in a newspaper of
general circulation in the county in which the well is located. The Division shall file proof of publication
before the application is approved. The notice shall include name and address of opplicant, location of
proposed injection or disposal well, injection zone, injection pressure and volume. If no written objection is
received within 15 days from date of publication the application will be approved administratively.

11. A well shall not be used for injection or disposal unless completed machine accounting Form
DOGM-UIC-3b is filed September 1st, each year.

12. Approval of this application, if granted, is valid only as long as there is no substantial change
in the operations set forth in the application. A substantial operation change requires the approval of a
new application.

13. If there is less intervening thickness required by Rule I-5 (b) 4 attach sworn evidence and data.

CASING ANDTUBINGDATA

NAME OF STRING SIZE SETTING SACKS TOP OF TOP DETERMINED
DEPTH CEMENT CEMENT BY

Surface
10-3(4" 223 160 surface returns

Intermediate

Production 7" 5935 400 4290 calculated

Tubing 2-3/8" 5480, 5625 Baker
ModNeam

4 5,
aËrPa kHerpkr @ 5610

Total Depth Geologic Name - Inj. Zone Depth - Top of In|. Interval Depth - Base of Inj. Interval
5936 Green River 5566 5714



.a
a·a (u) J

COMPLERON & škab GAiA b¥ Pat L;Uttr .. toxMAllON

(To be filed within 30 days ofter dri'ting is cesnpleted) 1 2 3

g/jf L COUNTY
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCESAND ENERGY **^*** ·

-

OIVISION OF OIL. GA5, AND MINING FORMATION
Room 4241 State Office Building

Green River

API NO 43-047-05428 5•!*L•k•City.Utah 64114 SPACINGA SPACING

COUNTYÜi tah SEC. O TWP. 7S RGE. 23E • 40-acre spacit g
COMPANYOPERATING CheVYon II.S.A. Tne-

,
CLASSINCATION Enhanced

omcs Aoomass P. O. Box 599 (Oil; Gos; Dry; inh Well) reCOVery

TOWN Y** STATE ZIP CO 80201 PERFORATED

w a FAamNAug Red Wash wetano. 14A See attached l‡st

ORILUNGSTARTED 2 /2119 ftL ORILLINGRNISHEDÂÍ,U 1961..

DAve or nasy PaoouctioN 4 (3 (61 courtavso 3 /27 /61 INTERVALS

WELLIOCATEDi¼ i¼ ¼

2.01.L...n. raon saor a sec.a MúL... n. soon wtor a sec.
ELEVATIONDERRICKnoosKB5687.8 GROUND 5675.9

· ACloizzo? Yes 111 perforated intenml

T¥PE COMPLETION

Single zone X ord.«No. • IRACTURETREATEDTYes3ee attached 1 i at

Multiple Zene Order No.

Comingled Order No.

LOCATION EXCEPTION Order No. ¶•noisy INITIALTESTDATA

- oitonoss zoNas 4-61

Nome From Te Nome From to

Green River 4500 5800 28
Gas. Cu. Ft./day MCF CF O

97
Goo-Oil Ratio Co. Ft./Bbl.

Water-Bbl./day
27

CASING& CEMENT Pumping er Hewing pumping
Cosing Set Csg. Test Cement CHOKESizE

Size Wgt Goode Feet Psi Sea Fillup Top
ROW TUBINGPRE5SURE -

'

10-3 /4" 40 . 5# J-55 223 2000 1 60 - sur f ace
A record af the formations dritted thre and ens remarks are presented en & sewesse.

7" 23# 3-55 5935 2500 600 - 6790
8, the undersigned, being first duty swom upon oath, siete that this weNreceed la true, corsect and compie

according to the secords a the office and to the best of my knowledge used belief.

IOÎ®glÑholte-

y to
tÍ . Neine end tiete of esprosealettue ei

totAt alPig 39 36 ene this day of '
, 19 .

PACKERS

.a
a·a (u) J

COMPLERON & škab GAiA b¥ Pat L;Uttr .. toxMAllON

(To be filed within 30 days ofter dri'ting is cesnpleted) 1 2 3

g/jf L COUNTY

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCESAND ENERGY **^*** ·

-

OIVISION OF OIL. GA5, AND MINING FORMATION
Room 4241 State Office Building

Green River

API NO 43-047-05428 5•!*L•k•City.Utah 64114 SPACINGA SPACING

COUNTYÜi tah SEC. O TWP. 7S RGE. 23E • 40-acre spacit g
COMPANYOPERATING CheVYon II.S.A. Tne-

,
CLASSINCATION Enhanced

omcs Aoomass P. O. Box 599 (Oil; Gos; Dry; inh Well) reCOVery

TOWN Y** STATE ZIP CO 80201 PERFORATED

w a FAamNAug Red Wash wetano. 14A See attached l‡st

ORILUNGSTARTED 2 /2119 ftL ORILLINGRNISHEDÂÍ,U 1961..

DAve or nasy PaoouctioN 4 (3 (61 courtavso 3 /27 /61 INTERVALS

WELLIOCATEDi¼ i¼ ¼

2.01.L...n. raon saor a sec.a MúL... n. soon wtor a sec.
ELEVATIONDERRICKnoosKB5687.8 GROUND 5675.9

· ACloizzo? Yes 111 perforated intenml
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Perforated Intervals (RWU 148)
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5631-32
5639-42
5646-49
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5687-88
5702-05
5712-14
5566-75
5580-84
5597-5607
5629-32
5637-49
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5669-81
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ed Wash Unit #13--228

PLAT SHOWINGLOCATIONOF THE STANDARDOIL
CONPHY OF CRIFORNR WELL IN THRN¾ OF THE
S SECT,ION22, TOWNSHIP7 SOUTH, RANGE23
EAST, SALT LAKE BASE ANDMBRIDIAN.

Scale of plat 1" = h00 feet.

We!I°Coc. i3r22d
o, s'obove Grade4#rou nd

- - éfoO E- .
Elev Sto7JS

I

I
I

I, Lean P. Christensen, of Vernal, Utah do hereby certify
that this plat correctly shows the location of the well shown
hereon as surveyed by me on November 16 and December 13. Levels
were run on December 13, 1960. Well is located at a point 566.6
feet South and 660 feet ßast from the West quarter corner Section
22, Township 7 South, Range 23 East, Salt Lake Base and
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Ground I,eyel 5675.90

10-3/4", 40.5 #/ft, J-55 @ 223'
Cemented to surface

Top of Upper Green River

2700'
7", 23 #/ft, J-55 @ 5935'
Cement top is @ 4290'

Too of Lower Green River
4500'

2-3/8", 4.7 #/ft, J-55

Baker Model 'A-5' Dual Packer
-c @ 5475'

Top perf @ 5566'

Injection Interval
-Baker Model 'FH' Packer

.. . @ 5610'
mm um

Bottom perf @ 5714' ¯ · · ·

PBTD =5735

Bottom of Lower Green River
± 5800'

T)=5936'

Red Wash Unit 148 (13-22B)
Wellbore
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CBL DESCRIPTIØNS

Injection Well
RNU No. 148 (13-223)

The CBL indicates the cement top is at + 4290'. Poor bonding exists from
4290' to 4390'. The bonding from 4390' to 5735' is of fair to good
quality. The injection interval is from 5566' to 5714'.

Offset Producers
RNU No. 13 (14-223)

The CBL shows fair bond quality from TD (5798') up to 4600' with good
bond intervals at 5710'-98', 5470'-5560', 5310'-80', and 4700'-4800'.
The top perforation is at 5192'. The remaining logged interval from
4600' to 4050' has poor bond quality with fair streaks throughout. The
cement top is calculated to be at 3441'.

RNU No. 26 (23-22B) -

The CBL indicates the cement top to be above the logged interval of
2550'. Good to fair bond quality exists from TD (5823') to 5540' with a
poor streak from 5620'-30'. Good bonding exists from 3320'-5540' and
good to fair bond quality exists up to the top of the logged interval.

RWU No. 90 (43-2137

A pertinent CBL is unavailable for No. 90. The cement top is calculated
to be at 3380'. The gross perforated interval is 5153'-5641½'.

RWUNo. 99 (12-223)

A cement bond log is not available for No. 99 (12-22B). The cement top
is calculated to be at + 3670'. The production interval is 5173'-5720'.

RWUNo. 140 (24-223)

The CBL shows good bond from TD (5743') throughout the entire perforated
interval of 5115'-5452', to the cement top at 4506'. A few poor streaks
exist from 5630'-5705', 5493'-5514', and 4630'-40'.

RNU No. 147 (22-223)

No. 147 has a cement top at 3260' with perforations at 5145'-5872'.
Cement bonding is fairly good down to 5500'. Thin poorly-bonded sections
exist within the intervals 4200'-4800' and
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ITTAHDIVISION OF OIL, GAS ANDMINING
CASING-BRADENHEADTEST

OPENGDR: CHEVRON U.S.A., INC.

FIELD: RED WASH LEASE: U-081

WELL# 13-22B (148) SEC. 22 T3662IPyg RANGE 73F

STATE FED. FEE DEPTH 5936 TYPE Minject·1anMAX. INJ. PRESS. 3500

IEST DKDE 7/12/84

PRESSURE
CASING STRING SIZE SET AT CMT READINGS REMARKS FUTURE

SŒŒACE 10 3/4" 223 160

INTERMEDIATE

PRIDDIK:TION 7" 5935 400 0 p.RT og

TUBING 2 3/8" 548Q PAC 2100 PRI og

TUßLUG 2 3/8" 5625 PAC 7175 PRI OK
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UTAH DIVISION OF OIL, GAS ANDMINING
CASING-BRADENHEADTEST

OPELET)R: CHEVRON, U.S.A., INC.

FIELD: Red Wash LEASE: U-081

WELL # 13-22B(148) NW SW SEC. 22 TOWNSHIP 78 RANGE 23E

STATE FED. FEE DEPTH 5936 TYPE WELLinjectiorNAX. IlU. PRESS. 3500 psi

IEST DKDE 8/23/84

PRESSURE
CASING STRING SIZE SET AT CMT READINGS REMARRS FUTURE

SOUTACE 10 3/4" 223 160

INTERMEDIATE

PRODIX:TION 7" 5935 400 5 Psi CTAP

TUBING SS 2 3/8" 5480 Pack 2010 psi

TUBERG LS 2 3/8" 5625 Pack Not injecting

REMARKS:
For June operator reported CTAP = 1890 psi on 7/12/84

CTAP = 0 psi. Well appears to be mechanically OK
at this
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Form 3160-5 LaITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(June 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004135
Expires: March 31, 1993

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U - 081

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. If Indian, Anottee or Tribe Name
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE 7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

1. Type of wen
RED WASH

O °i.» O wGaeH
Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator
148 (13-228)

CHEVRON U.S.A. PRODUCTION CO• 9. APIWellNo.

3. Address and Telephone No.
43-047-15261

P.O. BOX 599, DENVER, CO. 80201 (303) 930-3691 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. L o (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) RED WASH - GRN. RIVER

, 660 FWL, SEC. 22, T7S, R23E
11. CountyorParish,State

UINTAH, UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Abandonment Clme of Em

Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

O Final Abandonment Notice Ahäg Cang Comion to

Other STATUS oisposewater
(Note) Report results of multiple ompletion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Lql form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and givepertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionallydrilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

THIS WELL IS SHUT IN WHILE UPGRADING WELL TEST FACILITIES. WE WILL RE-EVALUATE STATUS AFTER WELL TEST
FACILITIES UPGRADES HAVE BEEN COMPLETED.

3 TEFILE

APR0 9 1992

DIVISION OF
OIL,GAS&MINING

14. I hereby cert t and arrect
Signed Title PERMIT SPECIALIST oate 3/31/92

(ThL 4aw ful re blal ut 2ate uffivo u.0)

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowinglyand willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or

representations as to any matter within its
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Fona 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(June logo) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR BudgetBureauNo. 10M135
Expires: Match 31, 1993

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
5. Designadan and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS U-081

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir.
6. If Indian,Allouse or Tribe Natue

Use "APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT-" for such proposals

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE 7. If Un or CA, Agnunnem Du
Red Wash Unit

1. Type of Weh

O T..O °·

a U o.. 8. We8 Natne and No.\ RWU #148 (13-22B)
2. Name of Operwor

Chevron U.S.A. Inc. 9. An w.n N..

3. Address and Telephone No.
43-A4Î-Î$ Î

P.O. Box 455, Vernal, Utah 84078 (801)789-2442 go. ,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,

4. laimlion of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Descripdan) Red Wash-Grn. River
11. County or Parish, Stale

4, 660 FWL, SEC. 22, T7S, R23E Uintah, Utah
76f6L

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, 3R OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Ned e onma Gange of Mans

Reco..pletion New constniedon
2 - a.., ] Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

O Final Ahmadonment Nado Aherg Cuk Convenundo Igcdan

13. DescribeProposedor Completed Operadens (Clearlystate aHpedinent delaHa,and give pertinentdates, includingendmated date of slaning any proposedwork. If mH is direedonaHydriued, give

subsurface locationsand incesured and true vedical depdu for au markersand zonespeninent to this wek.)

WeR test facility upgrades were completed in 1992. We plan to rtMwaluate this shut-in injection weR during 1993.

FEB1 8 1993

DMSIONOF
OILGAS&MWWP

14. I

Title I

(This space for Federalor State officeuse)

Appruerd by Titir Omte
Conditionsof approml, if any:

FVLARB-6.BLM URL
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Aechanical Iñtegrity Ten
Casing or Annulus Pressure Test

U. S . Environmental Protection Agency
Underground Injection Control Program, UIC Implementation Section, SWM-DW

999 18th Street, Suite 500, Denver, CO 80202-2466

EPA Witness: Date /_N/95 Time pm

Test conducted by:

Others present:

Well: | Well ID: QÍO

Field: ) g) Company: fil
Well Location: 21f Address: | Od2C /

Time Test #1 Test #2 Test #3

0 min (GÑ0 psig psig psig

5

10

15

20

25
30 min ogg

35
40

45

50
55

60 min

Tubing press psig psig psig .

Result teirei. Fail Pass Fail Pass Fail

Signature of EPA Witness:

See back of page for any additional comments & compliance followup.
This is the front side of two
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Mechanical Integrity Tese:
htsing or Annulus PressuuTest

U.S. Environmental Protection Agency
Underground Injection Control Program, CIC Implementation Section, SWM-DW

999 18th Street, Suite 500, Denver, CO 80202-2466

EPA Witness: Date / S/ Time li a.
Test conducted by: |-TMSL/\

Others present:

weli:(GU.. /Ÿ8Û3-O 63 ßgf*93,0 /Jay

Field:

well Location: ShenandoahEnergy, Inc.
A/C)S/4)-9 -95- £' 11002 East 17500 South

Vernal, Utah84078

Time Test 1 Test #2

/ 0 min psig psig CW) psig
i:or s /I e / 2d
i: Jo 10 //ib [ 7 o
¡; jy is //ÑO /7

i:3ePM3o min / Il l'T
35
40

45

50

55

60 min

Tubing press psig - psig psig .

Result teixei Fail Pass Fail Pass Fail
Signature of EPA Witness:

See back of page for any additional comments & compliance followup.
This is the front side of two
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MechanicalIntegrity Tese:
'

wasing or Annulus Pressitré Test
U.S. Environmental Protection Agency

Underground Injection Control Program, UIC Implementation Section, SWM-DW
999 18th Street, Suite 500, Denver, CO 80202-2466

EPA Witness: Date / 6 / Time /i a.
Test conducted by: An
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£PA LLTDayó ?
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55
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See back of page for any additional comments & compliance followup.
This is the front side of two
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Formaiso-s UNITED STATES FORM APPRovEu

us.« isso) DEP TMENT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Burcau No. 10044)135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993

5 Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposalS 5 Iffndian, AllottecorTribeName

N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICA TE T If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

1. Type of Well RED WASII UNIT
Oil Gas I-SEC NO 761

O *·" O ··" O Other MULTIPLE WELLS SEE ATTACllED LIST 8 Well Name and No

2. Name of Operator

CHEVRON U.S.A. INC. 9 API Well No.

3. Address and Telephone No

i1002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 (801) 781-4300 10 Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R , M., or Survey Description) RED WASH - GREEN RIVER
I I County or Parish, State

UINTAH, UTAH

12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, O i OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans

O Recompletion New Construction

SubyequentRepon Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

O Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to injection

Other CHANGE OF OPERATOR Dispose Water

(Note) Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form )

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all peninent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work if well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)

As of January 1, 2000 Chevron U.S.A. INC. resigns as Operator of the Red Wash Unit.
The Unit Number is I-SEC NO 761 effective October 31, 1950.

The successor operator under the Unit Agreement will be
Shenandoah Energy Inc.
475 17th Street, Suite 1000
Denver, CO 80202

Agreed and accepted to this 29th day of December, 1999 RECE IVED
Shenandc

el

EneSo

ic

Inc

DEC3 0 1999
President\ DIVISIONOFOIL,GAS&MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is inie and correct
signedA. E. Wacker

. .

Title Assistant Secretary Date 12/29/99

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Approved by: Tide Date

Conditions of approval, if any

Tide 15 U.S.C. Secdon 1001, makes is a crime for any person knowingly and willfully lo make to any departmentor agency of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or
represcalations as to any mauer withis its jurisdicdon.

*See instruction on Reverse
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining '

ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH 4-KAS--"
,

2. CDW 5-gfÈ/
3. JLT 6-FILE

Enter date after each listed item is completed

X Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent

Operator Name Change (Only) Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 01/01/2000

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
CHEVRON USA INC SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC
Address: 11002 E. 17500 S. Address: 11002 E. 17500 S.
VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 VERNAL, UT 84078

Phone: 1-(435)-781-4300 Phone: 1-(435)-781-4300
Account No. NO210 Account No. N4235

CA No. Unit: RED WASH

WELL(S)
NAME API ENTITY SECTION TOWNSHIP RANGE LEASE
RWU 14 (14-13B) (wiw) 43-047-15144 99996 13 07S 23E FEDERAL
RWU 183 (33-13B) (wiw) 43-047-15289 5670 13 07S 23E FEDERAL
RWU 185 (41-14B) (wiw) 43-047-16498 99996 14 07S 23E FEDERAL
RWU 34 (23-14B) (wiw) 43-047-15161 99996 14 07S 23E FEDERAL
RWU 156 (23-15B) (wiw) 43-047-15267 99990 15 07S 23E FEDERAL
RWU 268 (43-17B) (wiw) 43-047-32980 5670 17 07S 23E FEDERAL
RWU 174 (21-20B) (wiw) 43-047-15281 5670 20 07S 23E FEDERAL
RWU 173 (21-21B) (wiw) 43-047-16496 99996 21 07S 23E FEDERAL
RWU 182 (14-21B) (wiw) 43-047-16497 99996 21 07S 23E FEDERAL
RWU 6 (41-21B) (wiw) 43-047-16482 99996 21 07S 23E FEDERAL
RWU 148 (13-22B) (wiw) 43-047-15261 99996 22 07S 23E FEDERAL
RWU 91 (33-22B) (wiw) 43-047-16479 99996 22 07S 23E FEDERAL
RWU 23 (21-23B) (wiw) 43-047-15151 99996 23 07S 23E FEDERAL
RWU 25 (23-23B) (wiw) 43-047-16476 99996 23 07S 23E FEDERAL
RWU 2 (14-24B) (wiw) 43-047-16472 99996 24 07S 23E FEDERAL
RWU 59 (12-24B) (wiw) 43-047-16477 99996 24 07S 23E FEDERAL
RWU 275 (31-26B) (wiw) 43-047-31077 99996 26 07S 23E FEDERAL
RWU 11 (34-27B) (wiw) 43-047-15142 99996 27 07S 23E FEDERAL
RWU 56 (41-28B) (wiw) 43-047-15182 99996 28 07S 23E FEDERAL
RWU 264 (31-35B) (wiw) 43-047-30519 99996 35 07S 23E FEDERAL
RWU 279 (1l-36B) (wiw) 43-047-31052 99996 36 07S 23E FEDERAL

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 12/30/1999

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 08/09/2000

3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on:

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining '
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,
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OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 12/30/1999

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 08/09/2000

3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on:



4. Is the new operator registered in the StaŸof Utah: YES Business Number: 224885 .

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: 02/04/2000

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator
for wells listed on: 02/04/2000

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC" The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,

for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 08/24/2000

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 08/23/2000

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 08/23/2000

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: N/A

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: N/A

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed has furnished a bond: N/A

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on:

FILMING:
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on: Ë ' E' Û/

FILING:
1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:

4. Is the new operator registered in the StaŸof Utah: YES Business Number: 224885 .

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:
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8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC" The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,

for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 08/24/2000

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 08/23/2000

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 08/23/2000

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: N/A

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: N/A

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed has furnished a bond: N/A

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on:

FILMING:
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on: Ë ' E' Û/

FILING:
1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:



United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office RECElVED
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155 FEB07 2000
DIVISION OF

INREPLY REFER TO OIL, GAS AND MINING
UT-931

February 4, 2000
Shenandoah Energy Inc.
Attn: Rae Cusimano
475 17"' Street, Suite 1000
Denver, Colorado 80202

Re: Red Wash Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

On December 30, 1999, we received an indenture whereby Chevron U.S.A. Inc. resigned as Unit
Operator and Shenandoah Energy inc. was designated as Successor UnitOperator for the Red
Wash Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatoryparties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effective February 4,
2000. In approving thisdesignation, the Authorized Officer neitherwarrants nor certifies thatthe
designated party has obtained all required approval that would entitle it to conduct operations
under the Red Wash Unit Agreement.

Your statewide (Utah) oil and gas bond No. 0969 willbe used to cover alloperations within the
Red Wash Unit.

It is requested thatyou notifyall interested parties of the change in unit operator. Copies of the
approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriatefederal offices,with one copy
returned herewith.

Sincerely,

Is/ Robert A. Henricks

Robert A. Henricks
Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure

cc: Chevron U.S.A. Inc.

bcc: Field Manager - Vernal (wlenclosure)

932
File - Red Wash Unit (wlenclosure)
MMS - Data Management Division
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron
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SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC.
I 1002 E. 17500S.

VERNAL, UT 84078
PHONE: (435) 781-4300

FAX: (435) 781-4329
RED WASH UNIT

RW #11 (34-27B) SWSE-27-7S-23E 43-047-15142
RW #14 (14-13B) SWSW-13-7S-23E 43-047-15144

4 RW #148 (13-22B) NWSW-22-7S-23E 43-047-15261
RW #156 (23-15B) NESW-15-7S-23E 43-047-15267
RW #17 (41-20B) NENE-20-7S-23E 43-047-15146
RW #173 (21-21B) NENW-21-7S-23E 43-047-16496
RW #174 (21-20B) NENW-20-7S-23E 43-047-15281
RW #182 (14-21B) SWSW-21-7S-23E 43-047-16497
RW #183 (33-13B) NWSE-13-7S-23E 43-047-15289
RW #185 (41-14B) NENE-14-7S-23E 43-047-16498
RW #2 (14-24B) SWSW-24-7S-23E 43-047-16472
RW #23 (21-23B) NENW-23-7S-23E 43-047-15151
RW #25 (23-23B) NESW-23-7S-23E 43-047-16476
RW #261 (23-17B) NESW-17-7S-23E 43-047-32739
RW #264 (31-35B) NWNE-35-7S-23E 43-047-30519
RW #268 (43-17B) NESE-17-7S-23E 43-047-32980
RW #275 (31-26B) NWNE-26-7S-23E 43-047-31077
RW #279 (11-36B) NWNW-36-7S-23E 43-047-31052
RW #34 (-23-14B) NESW-14-7S-23E 43-047-15161
RW #56 (41-28B) NENE-28-7S-23E 43-047-15182
RW #59 (12-24B) SWNW-24-7S-23E 43-047-16477
RW #6 (41-21B) NENE-21-7S-23E 43-047-16482
RW #91 (33-22B) NWSE-22-7S-23E 43-047-16479
RW #93 (43-27B) NESE-27-7S-23E 43-047-16480
RW #134 (14-28B) SWSW-28-7S-23E 43-047-16489
RW #139 (43-29B) NESE-29-7S-23E 43-047-16490
RW #150 (31-22B) NWSE-22-7S-23E 43-047-15263
RW #16 (43-28B) NESE-28-7S-23E 43-047-16475
RW #170 (41-15B) NENE-15-7S-23E 43-047-16495
RW #263 (24-26B) SESW-26-7S-23E 43-047-30518
RW #265 (44-26B) SESE-26-7S-23E 43-047-30520
RW #266 (33-26B) NWSE-26-7S-23E 43-047-30521
RW #269 (13-26B) NWSW-26-7S-23E 43-047-30522
RW #271 (42-35B) SENE-35-7S-23E 43-047-31081
RW #68 (41-13B) NENE-l3-7S-23E 43-047-16485
RW #97 (23-18C) NESW-18-7S-24E 43-047-15216
RW #7 (41-27B) NENE-27-7S-23E 43-047-15205
RW #324 (23-16B) NESW-16-7S-23E
RW #301 (43-15B) NESE-15-7S-23E 43-047-31682
RW #100A (43-21A) NESE-21-7S-22E 43-047-15219
RW #199 (43-22A) NESE-22-7S-22E 43-047-15301
RW #216 (21-27A) NENW-21-7S-22E 43-047-30103
RW #258 (34-22A) SWSE-22-7S-22E 43-047-30458
RW #202 (21-34A) NENW-34-7S-22E 43-047-15303
RW 3215 (43-28A) NESE-28-7S-22E 43-047-30058
RW #61 (12-27A) SWNW-27-7S-22E 43-047-16478
RW #102 (41-24A) NENE-24-7S-23E 43-047-15221
RW #88 (23-18B) NESW-18-7S-23E 43-047-15210
RW #283 (43-18B) NESE-18-7S-23E 43-047-32982
RW #52 (14-18B) SWSW-18-7S-23E 43-047-15178
RW #161 (14-20B) SWSW-20-7S-23E
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RW #265 (44-26B) SESE-26-7S-23E 43-047-30520
RW #266 (33-26B) NWSE-26-7S-23E 43-047-30521
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RW #52 (14-18B) SWSW-18-7S-23E 43-047-15178
RW #161 (14-20B) SWSW-20-7S-23E



STATE OF UTAN
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND NINING

TRANSFER OF AUTHORITYTO INJECT - urc vous s
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Name . . e ( / //
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Title IN' Vernal, UT 84078

Date 'jf/'-< Phone ( 435 ) 781-4300
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining .

ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH

2. CDW
3. FILE

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent/Operator

X Operator Name Change Merger

The operator of the we11(s) listed below has changed, effective: 2/1/2003
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N4235-Shenandoah Energy Inc N2460-QEP Uinta Basin Inc

11002E 17500S 11002 E 17500S
Vernal, UT 84078-8526 Vernal, UT 84078-8526

Phone: (435) 78 1-434 1 Phone: (435) 78 1-434 1
CA No. Unit: RED WASH UNIT

WELL(S)
NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL conre

NO TYPE TYPE STATUS

RWU 100-A (43-21A) 21 070S 220E 4304715219 5670 Federal WI A
RWU 102 (41-24A) 24 070S 220E 4304715221 5670 Federal WI A
RWU 12-24A 24 070S 220E 4304733591 5670 Federal WI A
RWU 11-25A 25 070S 220Ei4304733574 5670 Federal Wl A
RWU 13-25A 25 070S 220Ei4304733575 5670 Federal \W! A
RWU 14 (14-13B) 13 070S 230El4304715144 5670 Federa! \WI A
RWU 156 (23-15B) 15 070S 230Ei430471526 5670 Federal .Wi A
RED WASH UNIT 261 17 070S 230E 4304732739 5670 Federal WI A
RWU 11-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733552 5670 Federal WI A
RWU 13-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733497 5670 Federal WI A
RWU 11-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733553 5670 Feoeral Wl A
RWU 13-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733498 5670 Federal W i A
RWU 161 (14-20B) 20 070S 230E 4304715271 5670 Federal WI I
RWU 17 (41-20B) 20 070S 230E 4304715146 5670 Federal WI A
RWU 148 (13-22B) 22 070S 230E 4304715261 5670 Federal WI A
RWU 150 (31-22B) 22 070S 230E 4304715263 5670 Federal WI I
RWU 11 27 070S 230E 4304715142 5670 Federal WI A
RWU 16 (43-288) 28 070S 230Ej4304716475 5670 Federal 'WI I
RWU 11-29B 29 070S 230E!4304733590 5670 Federal WI A
RWU 11-30B 30 070S 230E 4304733785 5670 Federal WI A

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator en: 6 2 03

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2003

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/19/2003

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 5292864-015 I

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

OEP UB 35 FORM

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining .
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OEP UB 35 FORM



6. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: 7/21/2003

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 7/21/2003

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,

for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 9/10/2003

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 9/16/2003

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 9/16/2003

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: n/a

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: m/a

STATE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965-003-032

FEDERAL WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESBOOOO24

INDIAN WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 799446

FEE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965-003-033

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
The Division sent response by letter on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS:

QEP UB 35 FORM
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QEP UB 35 FORM



tar Exploration and Production Company

endence Plaza

1050 17th Street, Suite 500

Denver, CO 80265

Tel 303 672 6900 • Fax 303 294 9632

Denver Division

May 28, 2003

Division of Oil, Gas, & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P. O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Attention: JohnBaza/JimThompson

Gentlemen:

This will serve as notice that through the intemal corporate changes described below,
activities formerly conducted in the name of either Shenandoah Operating Company, LLC
(SOC) and/or Shenandoah Energy, Inc. (SEI) will hereafter be conducted in the name of
QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.: i) the Shenandoah entities were purchased in July,2001 by Questar
Market Resources, Inc., which is a mid-level holding company for the non-utility businesses
of QuestarCorporation, ii) Shenandoah Operating Company, LLC has now been merged
into Shenandoah Energy, Inc. (SEI), iii) Shenandoah Energy, Inc. has now been re-named
QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. pursuant to a State of Delaware Amended and Restated Certiñcate
of Incorporation, iv) the same employees will continue to be responsible for operations of
the former SOC and SEI properties, both in the field and in the office. Accordingly, the
change involves only an internal corporate name change and no third party change of
operator is involved. Please alter your records to reflect the entity name change. Attached is
a spreadsheet listing all wells affected by this change.

Should you have any questions, please call me at 303 - 308-3056.

Yours truly,

rank Nielsen
Division Landman

Enclosure RE CEIVED
JUNO2 2003

DIVOF OIL,GAS&
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United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
UT-922

June 9, 2003

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
1050 17th Street, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265

Re: Red Wash Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

On May 30, 2003, we received an indenture dated February 1, 2003, whereby Shenandoah Energy,
Inc. changed it name and QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. was designated as Successor UnitOperator for the
Red Wash Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effective June 9, 2003.
In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the
designated party has obtained all required approval that would entitle it to conduct operations under
Red Wash Unit Agreement.

Your nationwide (Eastern States) oil and gas bond No. BOOOO24willbe used to cover all operations
within the Red Wash Unit.

It is requested that you notifyall interested parties of the name change of unitoperator. Copies of
the approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriate federal offices, with one copy
returned herewith.

Sincerely,

Is/ Robert A. Henricks

Robert A. Henricks
Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure
bcc: Field Manager - Vernal (wlenclosure)

SITLA
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
Minerals Adjudication Group
File - Red Wash Unit (wlenclosure)
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron
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JUL 0 7 2003
3104 (932.34)WF
Nationwide Bond ESBOOOO24

NOTICE

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. : Oil and Gas
1050 17* Street Suite 500 : lease
Denver, Colorado 80265 :

Name Change Recognized

Acceptable evidence has been filed in this office concerning the name change of Shenandoah
Energy Incorporated into QEP Uinta Basin, Incorporated. QEP Uinta Basin, Incorporated is the
surviving entity. This name change is recognized effective April 17, 2003.

Eastern States will notify the Minerals Management Service and all applicable Bureau of Land
Management offices of the change by a copy of this notice.

If you identify other leases in which the merging entity maintain an interest, please contact this
office and we will appropriately document those files with a copyof this notieg.

If you have any questions, please contact Bill Forbes at 703-440-1536.

Wilbert B. Forbes
Land Law Examiner

Branch of Use Authorization
Division of Resources Planning,

Use and Protection

bc: JFO,MMS, ES RF, 930 RF, 932.34 RF, E-932: wbf:07 /07/03:440-1536/ QEP Unita
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STATE OF UTAH UICFORM 5
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

TRANSFER OF AUTHORITY TO INJECT
WellName and Number APINumber

See Attached LLst
Locationof Well Fi or Unit Name

Footage : County :
Lease Designation and Number

QQ, Section, Township, Range: State : UTAH

EFFECTIVE DATE OF TRANSFER:

CURRENT OPERATOR

Company: Shenancinah Fnorgy I no Name: ...loku Boget
Address: 11002 East 17500 South signature: ..Je a

city VernaL statd JT zip 84078 Title: þ,y ge.»F fe er 44

Phone: (435) 781-4300 Date: 4- o2- or
Comments:

NEWOPERATOR

Company: QEP ULnta BasLn, Inc· Name: ..je en Base,L

Address: 11002 East 17500 South signature: A BR,

city VernaL state ! JT zip 84078 Title: b•¾Webé Farews
Phone: Date: 9-O2-e y
Comments:

(This space feorrapre uesdebyn

Approval Date:

Title:

RECEIVED
Comments: SEP

DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINING

STATE OF UTAH UICFORM 5
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DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
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Approval Date:

Title:

RECEIVED
Comments: SEP

DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINING



well_name Sec T R api Entity Lease Type type stat Field Footages
RED WASHUNIT261 17 070S 230E 4304732739 5670 Federal WI A Red Wash 1785 FSL, 1843 FWL
RVVU100-A(43-214) 21 070S 220E 4304715219 5670 Fedenal VW A Red\Nash 1787FSL,534FEL
RVVU102(41-24A) 24 070S 220E 4304715221 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 1360FNL,660FEL
RVWJ11 27 070S 230E 4304715142 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 660FSL,2030FELRVVU11-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733552 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 618FNL,477RNL
RVVU11-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733553 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 761FNL,677RNL
RVVU11-25A 25 070S 220E 4304733574 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 1206FNL,491 FVA.
RVVU11-29B 29 070S 230E 4304733590 5670 Fedenal VW A Red\Nash 786FNL,819FVVLRVVU11-30B 30 070S 230E 4304733785 5670 Fedenal VW A Red\Nash 590FNL,787FVVL
RVVU12-24A 24 070S 220E 4304733591 5670 Fedenal VW A Red\Nash 1528FNL,930FVML
RVVU13-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733497 5670 Federal VW A Red½fash 1802FSL,374FVVL
RVVU13-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733498 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 2143'FSL,704'FVW.
RVWJ13-25A 25 070S 220E 4304733575 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 1446FSL,664FVA.
RVVU14(14-13B) 13 070S 230E 4304715144 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 660FSL,660RNL
RVWJ148(13-22B) 22 070S 230E 4304715261 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 2073FSL,660FVA.
RVVU150(31-22B) 22 070S 230E 4304715263 5670 Federal VW I Red\Nash 595FNL,1935FEL
RWU 156 (23-15B) 15 070S 230E 4304715267 5670 Federal WI A Red Wash 2115 FSL, 1982 FWL
RWU 16 (43-28B) 28 070S 230E 4304716475 5670 Federal WI I Red Wash 1980 FSL, 660 FEL
RVVU161 (14-20B) 20 070S 230E 4304715271 5670 Fedenal VW I Red\Nash 660FSL,678FVVL
RVVU17(41-20B) 20 070S 230E 4304715146 5670 Fedenal VW A Red\Nash 660FNL,660FELRVVU170(41-15B) 15 070S 230E 4304716495 5670 Fedenal VW I Red\Nash 660FNL,660FEL
RVVU173(21-21B) 21 070S 230E 4304716496 5670 Fedenal VW A Red\Nash 660FNL,1980 FVVL
RWU174 (21-20B) 20 070S 230E 4304715281 5670 Federal WI A Red Wash 660 FNL, 1980 FWL
RVVU182(14-21B) 21 070S 230E 4304716497 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 629FSL,652FVW.
RVVU183(33-13B) 13 070S 230E 4304715289 5670 Fedenal VW A Red\Nash 1833FSL,2027FEL
RVVU185(41-1B) 14 070S 230E 4304716498 5670 Fedenal VW A Red\Nash 747FNL,660FEL
RVVU199(43-22A) 22 070S 220E 4304715301 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 1980FSL,658FEL
RWU2 (14-24B) 24 070S 230E 4304716472 5670 Federal WI A Red Wash 735 FSL, 790 FWL
FEAAJ202(21-34A) 34 070S 220E 4304715303 5670 Federal VW I Red\Nash 660FNL,1980FVW.
FUAAJ213(41-33B) 33 070S 230E 4304720060 5670 Federal VVD A Red\Nash 660FNL,580FEL
FBAAJ215(43428A) 28 070S 220E 4304730058 5670 Fedenal VW A Red\Nash 1980'FSL,661 FEL
FRAAJ216(21-27A) 27 070S 220E 4304730103 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 660FNL,1976RNL
FRAAJ23(21-23B) 23 070S 230E 4304715151 5670 Fedenal VW A Red\Nash 695FNL,2015FVVL
RVVU23-18C(97) 18 070S 240E 4304715216 5670 Federal VW I Red\Nash 1956FSL,1699RNL
RWU25 (23-23B) 23 070S 230E 4304716476 5670 Federal WI A Red Wash 1980 FSL, 1980 FWL
FDAAJ258(34-22A) 22 070S 220E 4304730458 5670 Federal VA A Red\Nash

well_name Sec T R api Entity Lease Type type stat Field Footages
RED WASHUNIT261 17 070S 230E 4304732739 5670 Federal WI A Red Wash 1785 FSL, 1843 FWL
RVVU100-A(43-214) 21 070S 220E 4304715219 5670 Fedenal VW A Red\Nash 1787FSL,534FEL
RVVU102(41-24A) 24 070S 220E 4304715221 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 1360FNL,660FEL
RVWJ11 27 070S 230E 4304715142 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 660FSL,2030FELRVVU11-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733552 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 618FNL,477RNL
RVVU11-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733553 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 761FNL,677RNL
RVVU11-25A 25 070S 220E 4304733574 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 1206FNL,491 FVA.
RVVU11-29B 29 070S 230E 4304733590 5670 Fedenal VW A Red\Nash 786FNL,819FVVLRVVU11-30B 30 070S 230E 4304733785 5670 Fedenal VW A Red\Nash 590FNL,787FVVL
RVVU12-24A 24 070S 220E 4304733591 5670 Fedenal VW A Red\Nash 1528FNL,930FVML
RVVU13-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733497 5670 Federal VW A Red½fash 1802FSL,374FVVL
RVVU13-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733498 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 2143'FSL,704'FVW.
RVWJ13-25A 25 070S 220E 4304733575 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 1446FSL,664FVA.
RVVU14(14-13B) 13 070S 230E 4304715144 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 660FSL,660RNL
RVWJ148(13-22B) 22 070S 230E 4304715261 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 2073FSL,660FVA.
RVVU150(31-22B) 22 070S 230E 4304715263 5670 Federal VW I Red\Nash 595FNL,1935FEL
RWU 156 (23-15B) 15 070S 230E 4304715267 5670 Federal WI A Red Wash 2115 FSL, 1982 FWL
RWU 16 (43-28B) 28 070S 230E 4304716475 5670 Federal WI I Red Wash 1980 FSL, 660 FEL
RVVU161 (14-20B) 20 070S 230E 4304715271 5670 Fedenal VW I Red\Nash 660FSL,678FVVL
RVVU17(41-20B) 20 070S 230E 4304715146 5670 Fedenal VW A Red\Nash 660FNL,660FELRVVU170(41-15B) 15 070S 230E 4304716495 5670 Fedenal VW I Red\Nash 660FNL,660FEL
RVVU173(21-21B) 21 070S 230E 4304716496 5670 Fedenal VW A Red\Nash 660FNL,1980 FVVL
RWU174 (21-20B) 20 070S 230E 4304715281 5670 Federal WI A Red Wash 660 FNL, 1980 FWL
RVVU182(14-21B) 21 070S 230E 4304716497 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 629FSL,652FVW.
RVVU183(33-13B) 13 070S 230E 4304715289 5670 Fedenal VW A Red\Nash 1833FSL,2027FEL
RVVU185(41-1B) 14 070S 230E 4304716498 5670 Fedenal VW A Red\Nash 747FNL,660FEL
RVVU199(43-22A) 22 070S 220E 4304715301 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 1980FSL,658FEL
RWU2 (14-24B) 24 070S 230E 4304716472 5670 Federal WI A Red Wash 735 FSL, 790 FWL
FEAAJ202(21-34A) 34 070S 220E 4304715303 5670 Federal VW I Red\Nash 660FNL,1980FVW.
FUAAJ213(41-33B) 33 070S 230E 4304720060 5670 Federal VVD A Red\Nash 660FNL,580FEL
FBAAJ215(43428A) 28 070S 220E 4304730058 5670 Fedenal VW A Red\Nash 1980'FSL,661 FEL
FRAAJ216(21-27A) 27 070S 220E 4304730103 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 660FNL,1976RNL
FRAAJ23(21-23B) 23 070S 230E 4304715151 5670 Fedenal VW A Red\Nash 695FNL,2015FVVL
RVVU23-18C(97) 18 070S 240E 4304715216 5670 Federal VW I Red\Nash 1956FSL,1699RNL
RWU25 (23-23B) 23 070S 230E 4304716476 5670 Federal WI A Red Wash 1980 FSL, 1980 FWL
FDAAJ258(34-22A) 22 070S 220E 4304730458 5670 Federal VA A Red\Nash



RMAJ263(244!6B) 26 070S 230E 4304730518 5670 Federal VW I Red\Nash 591 FSL,2007RNL
RWU 264 (31-35B) 35 070S 230E 4304730519 5670 Federal WI A Red Wash 687 FNL,2025 FEL
FRAAJ266(33426B) 26 070S 230E 4304730521 5670 Federal VW I Red\¾ash 1980FSL,1980FELFRAAJ268(43-17B) 17 070S 230E 4304732980 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 1924FSL,981 FEL
RMAJ269(13426B) 26 070S 230E 4304730522 5670 Federal VW I Red\Nash 2170'FSL,670'FVM
FRAAJ271(at!-35B) 35 070S 230E 4304731081 5670 Fedeml VW I Red\Nash 1979FNL,660FEL
FRAAJ274(13425B) 25 070S 230E 4304731083 5670 Federal VW Red½/ash 2129FSL,659 FVVL
RWU 275 (31-26B) 26 070S 230E 4304731077 5670 Federal WI A Red Wash 675 FNL,1869 FELFRAAJ279(11-36B) 36 070S 230E 4304731052 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 659FNL,660FVVLRVVU283(43-18B) 18 070S 230E 4304732982 5670 Fedenal VW A Red\Nash 1899FSL,708FELRVAJ31-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733555 5670 Federal VW A RedVVash 601FNL,1770FELRVAJ31-25A 25 070S 220E 4304733577 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 1248FNL,2159FELRVVU31-30B 30 070S 230E 4304733788 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 950FNL,1943FELRVVU33-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733499 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 2606FSL,1851 FEL
RWU33-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733500 5670 Federal WI A Red Wash 2210 FSL, 2295 FEL
RVVU2¾¾25A 25 070S 220E 4304733578 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 1413FSL,1809FEL
RVVU2¾¾30B 30 070S 230E 4304733790 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 1775FSL,1937FELRMAJ34(23-14B) 14 070S 230E 4304715161 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 1980FSL,1980RNL
RVVU 1-13A 13 070S 220E 4304733593 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 1302FSL,1725FEL
RVVU 1-24A 24 070S 220E 4304733568 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 1295FSL,2125FELFRAAJ48(32-19B) 19 0708 230E 4304715174 5670 Federal VW I Red\Nash 1830FNL,1980FELRVVUS6(41-28B) 28 070S 230E 4304715182 5670 Fedenal VA A Red\Nash 660FNL,660FELRVVU59(12-24B) 24 070S 230E 4304716477 5670 Fedenal VVI A Red\Nash 1980FNL,660FVVLRVVU6(41-21B) 21 070S 230E 4304716482 5670 Federal VW A Red\Nash 660'FNL,660FEL
RWU 61 (12-27A) 27 070S 220E 4304716478 5670 Federal WI l Red Wash 2034 FNL, 689 FWLFRAAJ68(41-13B) 13 070S 230E 4304716485 5670 Fedenal VW I Red\Nash 660FNL,660FEL
RVVU7(41-27B) 27 070S 230E 4304716473 5670 Federal VW I Red\Nash 567FNL,621 FEL
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RVVU91(33-22B) 22 0708 230E 4304716479 5670 Fedenal VW A Red\Nash 1980FSL,3300FVVL
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET
2. CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 1/1/2007

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2460-QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. N5085-QuestarE&P Company

1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265

Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900 Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900

CA No. Unit: RED WASH UNIT

WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

SEE ATTACHED LISTS *

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentationwas received from the FORMER operator on: 4/19/2007

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 4/16/2007
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 1/31/2005
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143

5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: n/a

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 4/23/2007 BIA
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 4/23/2007
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on:
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on:
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 799446
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965003033
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS: THIS IS A COMPANY NAME CHANGE.
SOME WELL NAMES HAVE BEEN CHANGED AS REQUESTED

Questar E&P FORM A.xls 4/30/2007 AND
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1 of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Wel1Name QIQ SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RWU l (41-26B) RW 41-26B 'NENE 26 070S 230E 4304715135 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 3 (34-23B) RW 34-23B SWSE 23 070S 230E 4304715136 5670 Federal OW P
RWU4(41-22B) RW41-22B |NENE 22 070S 230E 4304715137 5670 'Federal OW TA
RWU 5 (41-23B) RW 41-23B 'NENE 23 070S 230E 4304715138 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 8 (32-22B) RW 32-22B SWNE 22 070S 230E 4304715139 5670 Federal OW P
RTVLI9 (43-23B) livV43-23B FUESE 23 070S 230E 4304715140 5670 Federal O3AT P
RWU 10 (12-23B) RW 12-23B iSWNW 23 070S 230E 4304715141 5670 Federal OW TA
RNVU11 FCA'34-27B SVVSE 27 070S 230E 4304715142 99996 Federal VVI A
RWU 13 (14-22B) RW 14-22B SWSW 22 070S 230E 4304715143 5670 Federal OW TA
FCgr14-13B RYVl4-13B STVSTV 13 070S 230E 4304715144 99995 Federal YVI A
FDASJ15 (32-17C) FON32-17C STVNE 17 070S 240E

,
4304715145 5670 Fedenal CTWT P

RWU 17 (41-20B) RW 41-20B NENË 20 070S 230E 43047]5146 5670 Federal WI_ _ A
R3RTJl9 (34-.26B) 100/34-26B STVSE 26 070S 230E i 4304715148 5670 Federal GP¥ S
FONIJ21 (32-14B) ICA'32-14B S3ATTE 14 1070S 230E 4304715250 , 5670 Fedend OVV P
RWU23 (21-23B) RW 21-23B SENW 23 070S 230E 43_04715151 | 99996 Federal IWI A
RYVU24(34-14B) IUn'34-14B SNVSE 14 070S 230E 4304715152 5670 Federal ONV S
RWU 26 (23-22B) RW 23-22B NESW 22 070S 230E 4304715153 5670 Federal OW TA
RTVII27(43-14B) ECWf43-14B NESE 14 070S 230E 4304715154 5670 Fedend (TW' TTA
RM/U28 (43-22B) R3¥43-22B NESE 22 070S i 230E 4304715155 5670 Fedend ()?V P
RWU 29 (32-23B) RW 32-23B SWNE 23 070S 230E 4304715156 5670 Federal OW P
FCAT23-13B ICB123-13B FEESTV - 13 070S 230E 4304715157 5670 Fedeñd (iW1 T,4
FDARJ31 (34-22B) FUN34-22B STVSE 22 ' 070S 230E 4304715158 5670 Fedeñal OXV P
RWU 33 (14-14B) RW 14-14B SWSW 14 ) 070S 230E 4304715160 5670 Federal GW TA
R\VU34(23-14B) Ifn'23-14B FRESVV 14 |070S 230E 4304715161 99996 Federal 3¥I A
RW 43-13B RW 43-13B NESE 13 0708 230E 4304715162 5670 Federal OW TA
FERTO36(32-13B) R3¥32-13B SivliE 13 ! 070S 230E 4304715163 5670 Federal (39V P
RWU 38 (14-23B) RW 14-23B SWSW 23 0708 230E 4304715165 5670 Federal OW |P
RWU 39 (14-24A) RW 14-24A SWSW 24 070S 220E 4304715166 5670 Federal OW |TA
RWU40 (21-24B) RW 21-24B NENW 24 070S 230E 4304715167 5670 Federal OW TA
RSVU41 (34-13B) IUM/34-13B SVVSE 13 070S 230E 4304715168 5670 Fixieral ONV P
RWU42 (21-29C) RW 21-29C NENW 29 0708 240E 4304715169 5670 Federal GW P
R3VIJ43 (12-17B) R\V 12-17B SYVNIV 17 070S 230E ! 4304715170 5670 Fedend Cny P
RWU44 (32-33C) RW 32-33C SWNE 33 070S 240E : 4304715171 5670 Federal GW P
RWU45(23-30B) RW23-30B NESW 30 070S 230E 4304715172 5670 Federal OW TA
RTVU46(41-21C) Ifwf41-21C NENE 21 070S 240E 4304715173 5670 Fedend GAW 134
RYVU48(32-19B) ICA'32-19B SYVFUE 19 070S 230E 4304715174 99996 IFederd TVI I
RWU 49 (12-29B) RW 12-29B SWNW 29 070S 230E 4304715175 5670 Federal ,OW TA
RWU 50 (14-23A) RW 14-23A SWSW 23 070S 220E i 4304715176 5670 Federal OW -P
RWU 52 (14-18B) RW 14-18B SWSW 18 070S 230E | 4304715178 5670 Federal OW TA
RNVU53(41-25A) IEW'41-25A FRENE 25 070S 220E 4304715179 5670 Federal ONV TA
RTVII56(41-28B) Irgr41-28B EfiNE 28 070S 230E 4304715182 99996 Fedeml 5¥I
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FONIJ21 (32-14B) ICA'32-14B S3ATTE 14 1070S 230E 4304715250 , 5670 Fedend OVV P
RWU23 (21-23B) RW 21-23B SENW 23 070S 230E 43_04715151 | 99996 Federal IWI A
RYVU24(34-14B) IUn'34-14B SNVSE 14 070S 230E 4304715152 5670 Federal ONV S
RWU 26 (23-22B) RW 23-22B NESW 22 070S 230E 4304715153 5670 Federal OW TA
RTVII27(43-14B) ECWf43-14B NESE 14 070S 230E 4304715154 5670 Fedend (TW' TTA
RM/U28 (43-22B) R3¥43-22B NESE 22 070S i 230E 4304715155 5670 Fedend ()?V P
RWU 29 (32-23B) RW 32-23B SWNE 23 070S 230E 4304715156 5670 Federal OW P
FCAT23-13B ICB123-13B FEESTV - 13 070S 230E 4304715157 5670 Fedeñd (iW1 T,4
FDARJ31 (34-22B) FUN34-22B STVSE 22 ' 070S 230E 4304715158 5670 Fedeñal OXV P
RWU 33 (14-14B) RW 14-14B SWSW 14 ) 070S 230E 4304715160 5670 Federal GW TA
R\VU34(23-14B) Ifn'23-14B FRESVV 14 |070S 230E 4304715161 99996 Federal 3¥I A
RW 43-13B RW 43-13B NESE 13 0708 230E 4304715162 5670 Federal OW TA
FERTO36(32-13B) R3¥32-13B SivliE 13 ! 070S 230E 4304715163 5670 Federal (39V P
RWU 38 (14-23B) RW 14-23B SWSW 23 0708 230E 4304715165 5670 Federal OW |P
RWU 39 (14-24A) RW 14-24A SWSW 24 070S 220E 4304715166 5670 Federal OW |TA
RWU40 (21-24B) RW 21-24B NENW 24 070S 230E 4304715167 5670 Federal OW TA
RSVU41 (34-13B) IUM/34-13B SVVSE 13 070S 230E 4304715168 5670 Fixieral ONV P
RWU42 (21-29C) RW 21-29C NENW 29 0708 240E 4304715169 5670 Federal GW P
R3VIJ43 (12-17B) R\V 12-17B SYVNIV 17 070S 230E ! 4304715170 5670 Fedend Cny P
RWU44 (32-33C) RW 32-33C SWNE 33 070S 240E : 4304715171 5670 Federal GW P
RWU45(23-30B) RW23-30B NESW 30 070S 230E 4304715172 5670 Federal OW TA
RTVU46(41-21C) Ifwf41-21C NENE 21 070S 240E 4304715173 5670 Fedend GAW 134
RYVU48(32-19B) ICA'32-19B SYVFUE 19 070S 230E 4304715174 99996 IFederd TVI I
RWU 49 (12-29B) RW 12-29B SWNW 29 070S 230E 4304715175 5670 Federal ,OW TA
RWU 50 (14-23A) RW 14-23A SWSW 23 070S 220E i 4304715176 5670 Federal OW -P
RWU 52 (14-18B) RW 14-18B SWSW 18 070S 230E | 4304715178 5670 Federal OW TA
RNVU53(41-25A) IEW'41-25A FRENE 25 070S 220E 4304715179 5670 Federal ONV TA
RTVII56(41-28B) Irgr41-28B EfiNE 28 070S 230E 4304715182 99996 Fedeml 5¥I



2 of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N24 30) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RE 3 WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RWU 57 (12-18C) RW 12-18C SWNW 18 070S 240E 4304715183 : 5670 Federal :OW P
RWU 63 (21-22B) IRW 21-22B NENW 22 070S 230E 4304715186 i 5670 Federal GW TA
RWU 64 (32-27B) RW 32-27B SWNE 27 070S 230E

43047¯5187
5670 Federal OW TA

RNVII66(34-18B) RMT34-18B STVSE 18 070S 230E 4304715189 5670 Ëederal OTV P
RWU 67 (42-22B) iRW 42-22B _ _ SENE 22 070S 230E 4304715190 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 69 (21-27B) RW 21-27B NENW 27 070S 230E 4304715191 : 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 70 (23-22A) _ 'RW 23-22A NESW 22 070S 220E 4304715192 5670 Federal OW P
FONU71 (21-18C) PON21-18C NGENNV 18 070S 240E 4304715193 5670 Federal OYV P
RWU 72 (23-27B) |RW 23-27B NESW 27 070S | 230E 4304715194 5670 Federal IOW TA
RWU 74 (12-13B) IRW 12-13B SWNW 13 070S 230E 4304715196 5670 Federal GW S
RWU 75 (21-26B) iRW 21-26B NENW 26 070S 230E 4304715197 5670 Federal OW TA
RAVU76(32-18C) RM/32-18C STV>UI 18 |070S .240E 4304715198 567ÒFederal G\V P
RWU 77 (21-13B) RWU 77 (21-13B) NENW 13 ' 070S 230E 4304715199 5670 Federal OW P
FCA1378 (32-28B) RTV32-28B SNVIDE 28 070S 230E 4304715200 5670 Fedend CON P
RAVIJ79(12-27B) RAV12-27B SvibnW 27 070S 230E 4304715201 5670 Federd CON TA
R3N1180 (14-278) RV/ 14-27B SVVS3V 27 070S i 230E 4304715202 5670 Fedend CON S
RTVLí8l (41-31B) P3N41-31B FEEbni 31 070S . 230E 4304715203 5670 Federal CAN P
FDASJ83 (41-27A) RYV41-27A NEFUE 27 070S 220E 4304715205 5670 Federal CON P
R3NIJS4(44-14B)_ COT44-14B SESE 14 070S 230E 4304715206 5670 Fedeñd GRY P
R3¥\J88 (23-18B) RTV23-18B __ NESTV _ 18 i 070S 230E 4304715210 5670 Fedend TVI at
RNVU90(43-21B) RV/43-21B NESE 21 070S 230E 4304715211 5670 Federed 03¥ P
RWU92 (ll-23B) RW ll-23B NWNW 23 i 070S 230E 4304715212 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 94 (l2-22A) RW 12-22A SWNW 22 070S 220E 4304715213 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 23-18C (97) RW 23-18C NESW 18 070S 240E , 4304715216 99996 Federal WI I
RYYLI99(12-22B) Irvi 12-22B STVliv/ 22 0708 230E 4304715218 5670 Federal (39V IP
RWlJ 100-A (43-21A) RW 43-21A NESE 21 070S 220E 4304715219 5670 Federal iWI A
RWU 101 (34-21B) ,RW 34-21B SWSE 21 070S 230E | 4304715220 5670 Federal OW P
R3NIJ102 (41-24/k) 'R3N41-24A SETJE 24 070S 220E | 4304715221 5670 Federal .9VI A
B3N11103(34-15B) RMT34-15B STVSE 15 0708 230E 4304715222 5670 Fedenal |OVV P
P:41] 108(32-21B) GRTV32-21B SVVfDE 21 0708 230E - 4304715226 5670 Federal 139V P
R ÑU 109 (21-28B) RTV21-28B NElNYV \ 28 070S 230E 4304715227 5670 Fedenal CON P
RWU 110 (23-23A) RW 23-23A NESW 23 070S 220E 4304715228 : 5670 Federal OW P
R3¥U 111 (32-24A.) ICW'32-24A STVPRE , 24 070S 220E 4304715229 5670 Fedend 03¥ S
RWU 112 (32-28A) RW 32-28A SWNE 28 070S 220E 4304715230 5670 Federal OW S
BONIJ115(21-19B) RW121-19B FU]¾¾V 19 070S 230E 4304715 33 5670 Federal Cn¥ P
RWU 119 (43-29A) RW 43-29A _NESE 29 070S 220E 4304715236 5670 Federal OW |P
RWU 120 (23-28B) RW 23-28B NESW 28 070S 230E 4304715237 5670 Federal OW TA
RW 13-13B RW 13-13B NWSW 13 070S 230E 4304715238 5670 Federal GW P
R\VUl22(24-14B) RV/24-14B SESVV 14 070S 230E 4304715239 5670 Feden] CÃŸ :P
RMRJ125(34-19B) Ifn134-19B SNVSE 19 070S 230E 4304715242 5670 'Federid OAN T,4
RWU 126 (41-29A) RW 41-29A |NENE 29 ; 070S 220E 4304715243 5670 Federal iOW
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RE 3 WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status
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3 of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RWU 127 (12-19B) RW 12-19B SWNW 19 | 070S 230E 4304715244 5670 Federal OW S
RYVLI129 (14-15B) RM/ 14-15B SNVSNV 15 070S 230E 4304715246 5670 Federal ()VV P
RYVU133 (41-348) RTV41-34B 74EPJE 34 070S 230E 4304715250 5670 Federal ()VV pP
RWU 136 (43-19B) RW 43-198 NESE 19 070S 230E 4304715252 5670 FederaÏ|OW TA
RWU 137 (34-28B} RW 34-28B SWSE 28 070S 230E 4304715253 5670 Federal GW TA
RWU 138 (4 l-30B) RW 41-30B NENE O 070S 230E 4304715254 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 140 (24-22B) _ _ RW 24-22B SESW 22 070S 230E 4304715255 5670 Federal OW P
ICRUJ 141(11-27B) RAV11-27B ffwavyV 27 070S 230E 4304715256 | 5670 .Fedeml ,ONV 114
RWU 143 (33-14B) RW 33-14B NWSE 14 070S 230E 4304715257 5670 IFederal OW P
RWU 144 (21-18B) RW 21-18B NENW 18 070S 230E 4304715258 5670 Federal OW TA
ICA'24-13B RV/24-13B SESTV 13 0705 230E 4304715259 5670 Fedenal CB¥ 134
B3A1J147(22-22B) FUN22-22B SE245V 22 070S 230E 4304715260 5670 Federal Ovv 134
RWU 148 (13-22B) RW 13-22B NWSW 22 070S 230E I 4304715261 99996 Federal W1 A
FDASJ150(31-22B) Ifn131-22B FPAffE 22 070S 230E 4304715263 99996 Fedend VVI I
RWU 151 (42-14B) RW 42-14B _ SENE 14 | 070S 230E 4304715264 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 153 (14-29B) RW 14-29B SWSW 29 070S 230E 4304715265 5670 Federal OW IP
FEROJ156(23-15B) I gr23-15B

FEB¯MT
15 070S 230E 4304715267 99990 Fedend $W1 A

Ri¥U 158 (32-30B) RYl32-30B STVITE 30 . 070S 230E 4304715268 5670 Federal 139V P
FDA1]160(32-15B) Ifn'32-15B _ SVV>UE 15 070S 230E 4304715270 5670 Federal CON P
RWU 161 (14-20B) RW 14-20B SWSW 20 070S 230E 4304715271 99996 Federal , WI I
RANU 162(12-20B) __ RTV 12-20B STYT4Y/ 20 070S 230E 4304715272 5670 Federal ()?V P
RWU 164 (12-28B) RW 12-28B SWNW 28 070S 230E 4304715274 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 165 (32-26B) RW 32-26B SWNE 26 070S 230E 4304715275 5670 Federal GW TA
RWU 167 (23-21B) RW 23-21B NESW 21 0708 230E 4304715277 : 5670 Federal OW S
RWU 168 (23-24B) RW 23-24B ,NESW 24 070S 230E 4304715278 i 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 172 (21-30B) RW 21-30B NENW 30 0708 230E I 4304715280 : 5670 Federal OW TA
RIARJ174(21-20B) FØV21-20B EniblA' 20 0708 230E 4304715281 | 5670 Federal Y/I ik
FDA11176(31-28B) ICA'31-28B PPATVE 28 070S 230E i 4304715283 5670 Fedend CON 134
RWU 177 (42-28B) RW 42-28B SENE 28 070S 230E 4304715284 5670 Federal OW TA
IUn/22-13B Ifn/22-13B SElin' 13 070S 230E 4304715285 5670 Fedend ONV 354
RWU 180 (31-23B) _ _ RW 31-23B NWNE 23 070S 230E 4304715287 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 181 (34-30B) RW 34-30B SWSE 30 070S 230E 4304715288 5670 Federal OW P
IUn'33-13B RVV33-13B NRWSE 13 070S .230E 4304715289 5670 Fedeñd TVI A
RWU 184 (23-26B) [RW 23-26B NESW 26 070S I 230E 4304715290 5670 Federal GW S
RWU 188 (23-20B) RW 23-20B NESW , 20 . 070S 230E 4304715291 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 192 (41-33A) RW 41-33A NENE i 33 070S 220E 4304715294 5670 Federal OW P
R343] 193 (43-24B) EUR/43-24B NESE 24 070S 230E 4304715295

¯
5670 Federal CPN 134

RNVU194(12-14B) RTV12-14B SYVANY 14 070S 230E 4304715296 5670 Federal COW S
RYVLI196(23-17C) RAW23-17C FEESTV 17 070S 240E 4304715298 5670 Federal GRAT TAL

RWU 199 (43-22A) RW 43-22A NESE 22 070S 220E 4304715301 99996 Federal WI A
RWU 201 (32-28C) RW 32-28C iSWNE 28 070S 240E 4304715302 5670 Federal GW

3 of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status
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ICRUJ 141(11-27B) RAV11-27B ffwavyV 27 070S 230E 4304715256 | 5670 .Fedeml ,ONV 114
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RWU 165 (32-26B) RW 32-26B SWNE 26 070S 230E 4304715275 5670 Federal GW TA
RWU 167 (23-21B) RW 23-21B NESW 21 0708 230E 4304715277 : 5670 Federal OW S
RWU 168 (23-24B) RW 23-24B ,NESW 24 070S 230E 4304715278 i 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 172 (21-30B) RW 21-30B NENW 30 0708 230E I 4304715280 : 5670 Federal OW TA
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R343] 193 (43-24B) EUR/43-24B NESE 24 070S 230E 4304715295

¯
5670 Federal CPN 134

RNVU194(12-14B) RTV12-14B SYVANY 14 070S 230E 4304715296 5670 Federal COW S
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4 of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RTVU202(21-34A) IUw/21-34A NENTV 34 0708 220E 4304715303 99996 Fedem] VVI I
Ifül]204(23-25As) BON23-25As NESTV 25 070S 220E 4304715305 5670 Fedend CON P
F3ARJ205(23-21C) FON23-21C NESNV 21 070S 240E 4304715306 5670 Fedenal CON TA
IUMTU2(144b‡B) RNV144L4B STVSNV 24 070S 230E 4304716472 99996 Fedend VVI A
RWU 7 (41-27B) RW 41-27B |NENE 27 070S 230E 4304716473 99996 Federal |WI I
RWR43-28B) RW 43-28B \NESE 28 070S 230E 4304716475 99996 Federal WI I
RWU 25 (23-23B) RW 23-23B NESW 23 070S 230E 4304716476 99996 Federal WI A
RWU 59 (12-24B) RW 12-24B SWNW 24 070S 230E 4304716477 99996 Federal WI A
RWU 61 (12-27A) RW 12-27A SWNW 27 070S 220E | 4304716478 99996 Federal .WI _ I
RWU 91 (33-22B) RW 33-22B INWSE 22 070S 230E 4304716479 99996 Federal WI A
RWU 93 (43-27B) RW 43-27B INESE 27 070S 230E 4304716480 99996 Federal WI I
RWU 6 (41-21B) RW 41-21B INENE 21 070S 230E I 4304716482 99996 Federal WI A
RTVII68 (41-13B) gr41-13B JfEFU: 13 070S 230E 4304716485 99996 Federal YVI I
RWU 170 (41-15B) RW 41-15B NENE 15 070S 230E . 4304716495 99996 Federal WI I
RWU 173 (21-21B) RW 21-21B NENW 21 070S 230E 4304716496 99996 Federal WI A
RWU 182 (14-21B) RW 14-21B SWSW 21 070S I 230E 4304716497 99996 Federal WI A
FDARJ185(41-lB) Rw/41-14B NHilfE 14 070S i230E i 4304716498 99996 Fedend Vil A
RTV11212(41-8F) ECn'41-8F NG:NE 08 080S '240E 4304720014 5670 Fedentl GM' P
RWU 213 (41-33B) RW 41-33B NENE 33 070S 230E 4304720060 99996 Federal WD A
RWU 215 (43-28A) RW 43-28A NESE _28 | 070S 220E 4304730058 99996 Federal WD A
RNVU216(21-27A) _ IEW21-27A PLEbnV 27 070S 220E 4304730103 99996 Fedeñd YVI A
RWU 219 (44-21C) RW 44-21C SESE 21 070S 240E 4304730 149 5670 Federal GW S
EUMTU220(22-23B) R3A'22-23B SEf4vl 23 070S 230E 4304730192 5670 Fedend ()?V T,4
RWU 221 (13-27B) RW 13-27B NWSW 27 070S 230E 4304730199 5670 Federal OW TA
RYTU222(31-27B) R3A'31-27B FTYl>pi 27 0708 230E 4304730200 5670 Federal :(39V TA
RWU 224 (44-22B) RW 44-22B SESE 22 070S 230E 4304730202 5670 Federal IGW TA
B¾All225 (13-23E() FCA/13-23B f VISTV 23 070S 230E 4304730212 5670 Federal (39V TIL
RWU 226 (24-23B) RW 24-23B SESW 23 0705 230E 4304730249 5670 Federal i GW S
RWU 227 (14-26B) RW 14-26B SWSW 26 0708 230E 4304730257 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 228 (21-34B) RW 21-34B NENW 34 0708 230E 4304730258 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 229 (43-26B) RW 43-26B NESE 26 070S 230E 4304730259 5670 Federal OW TA
R3411230(l4-18C) Rvi 14-18C SVVSVV 18 070S 240E 4304730309 5670 Federal O'N P
RWU 231 (21-35B) RW 21-35B NENW 35 070S 230E 4304730310 ' 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 232 (12-26B) RW 12-26B _ _ .SWNW 26 070S 230E 4304730311 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 233 (12-25B) RW 12-25B SWNW 25 070S 230E : 4304730312 i 5670 Federal OW TA
RNVU234(32-24B) R'n'32-24B SYVÏË 24 070S 230E

,
4304730313 5670 Fedend CON P

RWU 235 (34-18C) RW 34-18C .SWSE 18 070S 240E 4304730314 5670 Federal OW S
RTVU236(21-19C) RAN21-19C 14ElfM/ 19 070S 240E 4304730340 5670 Feden11 GON P
R3VU237(14-25B) RNV14-25B SNVSTV 25 070S 230E 4304730341 5670 Fedend ONV P
RTVLI238 (32-35B) R3¥32-35B 89VT(E_ 35 070S 230E 4304730342 5670 Federal ()?V Tit
RWU 239 (41-35B) RW 41-35B NENE 35 0708 230E 4304730343 5670 Federal OW

4 of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status
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,
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RTVLI238 (32-35B) R3¥32-35B 89VT(E_ 35 070S 230E 4304730342 5670 Federal ()?V Tit
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5 of 7 QEP UintaBasin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
REDWASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

80A'IU240(12-36B)
___

FUN12-36B STVITY/ 36 070S 230E 4304730344 5670 Federal O'N S
EDNIJ241(22-14B) RM/22-14B SEFUN 14 0708 230E 4304730345 5670 Federal OYV P
Ein'42-13B f gr42-13B SEffE 13 070S 230E 4304730346 5670 Fedend ONV P
RIVIJ243 (42-18C) fin/42-18C SEffE 18 0705 240E 4304730347 5670

Fede¯l
COW TA

BDA1J244(23-19C) PD¥23-19C NESTV 19 0708 240E 4304730348 5670 Ipderal GRW P
90ARJ246(22-18C) RNV22-18C_ SElfvl 18 0708 240E 4304730387 5670 Federal ETür P
RIVIJ247(22-17C) RM/22-17C SElfv/ 17 0708 240E 4304730388 5670 Fedenil GAV P
RWU 258 (34-22A) RW 34-22A SWSE 22 0708 220E 4304730458 567ÖFederal WI A
RWU 262 (22-26B) RW 22-26B SENW 26 0708 230E 4304730517 5670 Federal GW ITA
RWU 263 (24-26B) RW 24-26B SESW 26 070S 230E I 4304730518 99996 Federal WI I
RTVU264(31-35B) Ituf31-35B 1(VTNE 35 070S 230E 4304730519 99996 Federal NVI A
RWU 265 (44-26B)

¯
RW 44-26B SESE 26 070S 230E 4304730520 5670 Federal GW P

RWU 266 (33-26B) RW 33-26B .NWSE 26 070S 230E 4304730521 I_9999_6 Federal WI |I
RWU 269 (13-26B) RW 13-26B INWSW 26 070S 230E 4304730522 99996 Federal WI A
RWU273(42-27B) RW42-27B SENE 27 070S 230E 4304731051 5670 Federal OW _TA
RWU 279 (11-36B) RW ll-36B NWNW 36 .

070S . 230E 4304731052 99996 Federal WI A
RWU 276 (44-27B) RW 44-27B SESE 27 | 070S I 230E 4304731053 5670 Federal OW TA
FUNU272(44-23B) RTV44-23B SESE 23 070S 230E 4304731054 5670 Federed GSV P
RNVU278(11-26) RTVll-26 FDAlfy/ 26 070S4_230E 4304731076 5670 Federed Giv TA
RWU 275 (31-26B) RW 31-26B NWNE 26 070S 230E 4304731077 99996 Federal WI A
RWU 280 (ll-35B) RW 11-35B NWNW 35 070S 230E 4304731079 5670 Federal OW

¯

RWU 282 (42-26B) RW 42-26B SENE 26 070S 230E 4304731080 5670 Federal GW TA
RY/U271 (42-35B) R3W42-35B SERVE 35 0708 | 230E 4304731081 5670 Federal VVI I
R3A3J270(22-35B) RTV22-35B SEfivV 35 0708 230E 4304731082 | 5670 Federal ()TV P
RWU284(33-23B) IRW33-23B NWSE i23 0708 230E,4304731476.5670Federal IGW TA
RWU 285 (11-24B) RW ll-24B NWNW I 24 0708 230E I 4304731477 5670 Federal OW P
RETU286(42-21B) (R3N42-21B SETTE I 21 0708 230E 4304731478 '

5670 Federal (39V JP
R3N44-13B R3W44-13B SESE 13 070S 230E 4304731512 5670 Federal ()?V Tik
RWU 288 (24-27) RW 24-27 .SESW 27 070S 230E 4304731513 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 289 (13-24B) RW 13-24B NWSW 24 070S 230E 4304731517 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 292 (42-23B) RW 42-23B SENE 23 070S 230E 4304731576 5670 Federal GW TA
RWU 295 (11-22B) RW 11-22B NWNW 22 070S 230E 4304731577 5670 Federal GW TA
RTVU296(12-35B) RSV12-35B STV>SV 35 1070S 1230E 4304731578 5670 Federal CTW7 S
RWU 297 (24-15B) RW 24-15B SESW 15 070S 230E 4304731579 5670 iFederal OW P
RWU 293 (22-22A) RW 22-22A SENW 22 070S 220E 4304731581 5670 Federal OW TA
P3WU294(24-18C) RV/24-18C SESTV 18 ,070S 240E 4304731582 5670 Federal GNV P
RWU 298 (22-27B) RW 22-27B SENW 27 070S 230E 4304731679 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 301 (43-15B) RW 43-15B NESE 15 0708 230E 4304731682 5670 Federal GW TA
RWU 302 (22-24B) RW 22-24B SENW 24 0708 230E 4304731683 5670 Federal GW TA
RM11303(34-17B) RM/34-17B SVVSE I 17 0708 230E 4304731819 5670 Federal OVV P
RED WASH 305 (41-4F) RW 41-4F C-NE 04 080S 240E 4304732538 | 5670 Federal GW
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6 of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RED \VrtSEl306 ICR/23-23C 14ESTV 23 070S 240E 4304732629 5670 Federal Cygr p
RTVII207 RYVl4-17B STVSTV 17 0708 230E 4304732738 5670 Federal Cygr p
RED WASH UNIT 261 RW 23-17B NESW 17 0708 230E 4304732739 5670 Federal WI A
ECurU268 (4i-Ï7E6 R3W43-17B _ FEBSE 17 0708 230E 4304732980 5670 Federal VVI A
RTVIJ267(32-17B) IEgr32-17B SvibHi 17 0708 230E 4304732981 5670 Federed Cygr y
RYVLI283(43-18B) RAN43-18B NESE 18 0708 230E 4304732982 5670 Federal VVI A
RYVU299(32-18B) fin'32-18B 89V>UE 18 0708 230E 4304733018 5670 Federal IONV P
RWU 42-20B RW 42-20B SENE 20 070S 230E 4304733490 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 22-20B RW 22-20B SENW 20 070S 230E 4304733491 5670 Federal OW S
RSVU24-19B Ein'24-19B SESJV 19 070S 230E 4304733492 5670 Federal iONV P
R3NIJl3-19B RNVl3-19B NWVSVV 19 070S 230E 4304733497 , 5670 FederEd NVI Á
RWU 13-20B _ RW 13-20B NWSW 20 070S 230E 4304733498 5670 Federal WI A
RW1133-19B RM'33-19B FAVSE 19 .070S 230E 4304733499 5670 Federed VVI A
EUMTU33-20B R'Ar33-20B fŒYVSE 20 070S 230E 4304733500 5670 Federal VI A
RED WASH 22-21B RW 22-21B SENW 21 070S 230E 4304733522 5670 Federal OW S
RED WASH 24-20B IRW 24-20B SESW 20 070S 230E 4304733523 5670 Federal OW P
RED n'ASH44-19B iltn'44-19B SESE 19 070S 230E 4304733524 5670 Fedend Cfni P
RED WASH 44-20B RW 44-20B SESE 20 070S 230E 4304733525 5670 Federal OW P
R N1111-19B RTV11-19B NVŒNNV 19 070S 230E 4304733552 5670 Fedend TVI A
FDA3]11-20B R'N 11-20B NIV7IV/ 20 0708 230E 4304733553 5670 Federal TVI A
RTVII24-18B ECW'24-18B SESTV 18 070S 230E 4304733554 5670 Federal CON P
RW 31-19B RW 31-19B NWNE 19 070S 230E 4304733555

¯Š¯76
Federal IWI A

RWU 42-19B RW 42-19B SENE 19 070S 230E 4304733556 . 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 22-19B RW 22-19B SENW 19 070S 230E 4304733559 5670 [Federal OW iP
RWU 23-24A RW 23-24A NESW | 24 070S 220E 4304733567 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 34-24A RW 34-24A SWSE 24 070S 220E 4304733568 5670 Federal WI A
RWU 42-24A RW 42-24A SENE 24 070S 220E 4304733569 5670 Federal OW S
R3¥\J 11-25/s RYVll-25/L bnA14NV 25 070S 220E 4304733574 5670 Federal VVI A
R3431 13-25/k RVI 13-25/t __ fiY/STV 25 070S 220E 4304733575 5670 Federal VVI A
RTVIJ21-25A Itur21-25A NENYV . 25 070S 220E 4304733576 5670 Fedend O1AT P
RTVII31-25A ffü'31-25A FDATIE 25 070S |220E 4304733577 5670 Fedend VVI A
R3WIJ33-25/s RYl33-25/L fiv/SE 25 070S 220E 4304733578 5670 Federal 1¥I A
y gr41-25AJ< RS/41-25A ILENHi 25 070S 220E 4304733579 5670 ÈedeñdCON P
ffMTU42-25/t RTVLI42-25/t SEbni 25 0708 220E 4304733580 5670 Federal ()97 Trk
RWU ll-29B RW ll-29B NWNW 29 0708 230E 4304733590 5670 Federal WI A
FDASJ12-24)t llTV 12-24/6 S\¾749V 24 070S 220E 4304733591 5670 Federal 9/1 A
RWU 21-24A RW 21-24A NENW 24 070S 220E 43047335 2 5670 Federal OW P
RSVU34-13A RM/34-13A STVSE 13 070S 220E 4304733593 5670 Federal TVI A
EUMTU44-18B RIN44-18B SESE 18 070S .230E 4304733594 5670 Federal ()VV P
ITET22-13/t fin/22-13A SETTwi 13 070S .220E 4304733765 13296 Fedend ¡ONV S
RTTLT22-29Il FON22-29B SE199V i 29 i 070S | 230E 4304733766 5670 Federal ()?V

6 of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status
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¯Š¯76
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RTVIJ21-25A Itur21-25A NENYV . 25 070S 220E 4304733576 5670 Fedend O1AT P
RTVII31-25A ffü'31-25A FDATIE 25 070S |220E 4304733577 5670 Fedend VVI A
R3WIJ33-25/s RYl33-25/L fiv/SE 25 070S 220E 4304733578 5670 Federal 1¥I A
y gr41-25AJ< RS/41-25A ILENHi 25 070S 220E 4304733579 5670 ÈedeñdCON P
ffMTU42-25/t RTVLI42-25/t SEbni 25 0708 220E 4304733580 5670 Federal ()97 Trk
RWU ll-29B RW ll-29B NWNW 29 0708 230E 4304733590 5670 Federal WI A
FDASJ12-24)t llTV 12-24/6 S\¾749V 24 070S 220E 4304733591 5670 Federal 9/1 A
RWU 21-24A RW 21-24A NENW 24 070S 220E 43047335 2 5670 Federal OW P
RSVU34-13A RM/34-13A STVSE 13 070S 220E 4304733593 5670 Federal TVI A
EUMTU44-18B RIN44-18B SESE 18 070S .230E 4304733594 5670 Federal ()VV P
ITET22-13/t fin/22-13A SETTwi 13 070S .220E 4304733765 13296 Fedend ¡ONV S
RTTLT22-29Il FON22-29B SE199V i 29 i 070S | 230E 4304733766 5670 Federal ()?V



7 of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RV/U41-24A R3Y41-24/t IEEbnE 24 070S 220E 4304733769 5670 Federal CAW P
RWU42-30B RW42-30B SENE | 30 070S 230E 4304733771 5670 Federal OW P
FUMTU44-30B R342J44-30B SESE 30 070S 230E 4304733772 5670 Federal ()VV P
RTVUll-30B RYVll-30B FAV>DN: 30 070S 230E 4304733785 5670 Federal TVI A
RTVU22-25As Fi'N22-25/t SEff9/ i 25 070S 220E 4304733786 5670 Fedent] CON P
RYTET31-30B __ FCAT31-30B NBA24E [ 30 070S 230E 4304733788 5670 Fedend TVI A
POWIJ33-30Il FUN33-30B NONSE : 30 070S 230E 4304733790 5670 Fedend TVI At
RED WASH U 34-27C RW 34-27C SWSE 27 070S 240E 4304735045 5670 Federal GW P
FDASJ34-22C Itur34-22C STVSE 22 ; 070S 240E 4304735098 5670 Federd GNV P
F 12Gi-20C RNV12G-20C SNV>SV 20 | 070S 240E 4304735239 14011 Federal GD¥ S
RM/43G-08F RMT43Gi-08F NESE 08 080S 240E .4304735655 Fedend GilV Ad?D
RM/22Gi-09F RM/22Gi-09F SEbnV 09 OSOS 240E |430473565615636 IFederal GIV OPS
RWU 34-23AG RW 34-23AG SWSE 23 070S 220E ' 4304735668 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 34-27AG RWU 34-27AD |SWSE 27 070S 220E 4304735669

' 5670 Federal OW DRL
R\N1J32-27/tGi RY/U32-27/uG SYVfdE 27 070S i220E 4304735670 : 5670 Federal CAAT S
RW 14-34AMU RW 14-34AMU SWSW 34 070S 220E Í 4304735671 i 14277 Federal GW P
RW 12-08FG RW 12-08FG SWÑW

¯
08 080S 240E 4304736348 |Federal GW APD

RTVakt-08FG RTV645-08FG SESE 08 080S 240E 4304736349 15261 Federal GNV P
RSV12-17FG RTV12-17FG SNVbnV 17 080S |240E 4304736350 Federal GDW APD
RW 34-34 AMU RW 34-34 AD SWSE I 34 070S 220E 4304736351 Federal GW APD
RW 44-35 AMU RW 44-35 AMU SESE 35 070S 220E 4304736352 Federal GW APD
RW 14-35 AMU RW 14-35 AMU SWSW 35 070S 220E 430473635 i Federal GW ÄPD
RW 33-31 BMU RW 33-31 BD NWSE 31 070S 230E 4304736357 Federal GW APD
RW 13-31 BMU RW 13-31 BD NWSW I 31 070S 230E 4304736358 Federal GW APD
RM/32-15FGi RYl32-15FGi SMOVE I 15 10803 240E 4304736443 Federal GON Ad?D
RW 21-26AG RW 21-26AD NENW 26 : 0708 220E 4304736768 Federal OW APD
RAV43-26AvG R3W43-26/cG FRESE 26 0708 220E 4304736769 Federal (TRI AUPD
RW43-23AG IRW43-23AG NESE 23 070S 220E 4304736770 I Federal OW APD
RW 41-26AG

, RW 41-26AG
_ _

NENE 26 0708 220E 4304736818 i iFederal OW APD
RW 04-25BG .RW 04-25B NWSW 25 0708 230E 4304736982 : Federal OW APD
RW 01-25BG RW 01-25BG NWNW 25 070S 230E 4304736983 Federal OW APD
RW 04-26BG RW 04-26BG SESW 26 070S 230E 4304736984 Federal OW APD
RM101-26BG RM101-26BG SYVNAV 26 070S 230E 4304736985 Federd ONV AJ'D
RW 01-35BG RW 01-35BG SWNW 35 07ÒS 230E 4304736986 Federal IOW

7 of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status
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RWU42-30B RW42-30B SENE | 30 070S 230E 4304733771 5670 Federal OW P
FUMTU44-30B R342J44-30B SESE 30 070S 230E 4304733772 5670 Federal ()VV P
RTVUll-30B RYVll-30B FAV>DN: 30 070S 230E 4304733785 5670 Federal TVI A
RTVU22-25As Fi'N22-25/t SEff9/ i 25 070S 220E 4304733786 5670 Fedent] CON P
RYTET31-30B __ FCAT31-30B NBA24E [ 30 070S 230E 4304733788 5670 Fedend TVI A
POWIJ33-30Il FUN33-30B NONSE : 30 070S 230E 4304733790 5670 Fedend TVI At
RED WASH U 34-27C RW 34-27C SWSE 27 070S 240E 4304735045 5670 Federal GW P
FDASJ34-22C Itur34-22C STVSE 22 ; 070S 240E 4304735098 5670 Federd GNV P
F 12Gi-20C RNV12G-20C SNV>SV 20 | 070S 240E 4304735239 14011 Federal GD¥ S
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R\N1J32-27/tGi RY/U32-27/uG SYVfdE 27 070S i220E 4304735670 : 5670 Federal CAAT S
RW 14-34AMU RW 14-34AMU SWSW 34 070S 220E Í 4304735671 i 14277 Federal GW P
RW 12-08FG RW 12-08FG SWÑW

¯
08 080S 240E 4304736348 |Federal GW APD

RTVakt-08FG RTV645-08FG SESE 08 080S 240E 4304736349 15261 Federal GNV P
RSV12-17FG RTV12-17FG SNVbnV 17 080S |240E 4304736350 Federal GDW APD
RW 34-34 AMU RW 34-34 AD SWSE I 34 070S 220E 4304736351 Federal GW APD
RW 44-35 AMU RW 44-35 AMU SESE 35 070S 220E 4304736352 Federal GW APD
RW 14-35 AMU RW 14-35 AMU SWSW 35 070S 220E 430473635 i Federal GW ÄPD
RW 33-31 BMU RW 33-31 BD NWSE 31 070S 230E 4304736357 Federal GW APD
RW 13-31 BMU RW 13-31 BD NWSW I 31 070S 230E 4304736358 Federal GW APD
RM/32-15FGi RYl32-15FGi SMOVE I 15 10803 240E 4304736443 Federal GON Ad?D
RW 21-26AG RW 21-26AD NENW 26 : 0708 220E 4304736768 Federal OW APD
RAV43-26AvG R3W43-26/cG FRESE 26 0708 220E 4304736769 Federal (TRI AUPD
RW43-23AG IRW43-23AG NESE 23 070S 220E 4304736770 I Federal OW APD
RW 41-26AG

, RW 41-26AG
_ _

NENE 26 0708 220E 4304736818 i iFederal OW APD
RW 04-25BG .RW 04-25B NWSW 25 0708 230E 4304736982 : Federal OW APD
RW 01-25BG RW 01-25BG NWNW 25 070S 230E 4304736983 Federal OW APD
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1 of 1 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RWU 51 (12-16B) RW 12-16B SWNW 16 070S 230E 4304715177 5670 State OW P
RWU ST 189 (41-16B) RW 41-16B NENE 16 070S 230E 4304715292 5670 State iOW S
RED WASH UNIT 259 RW 14-16B SWSW 16 070S 230E 4304732785 5670 State OW _ _ P
RED WASH UNIT 260 RW 34-16B SWSE 16 070S 230E 4304732786 5670 State OW P
RWU 324 (23-16B) RW 23-16B SESW 16 070S 230E 4304733084 5670 State WI OPS
RWU 21W-36A _ RWU 21W-36A NENW 36 070S 220E ; 4304733730 State GW LA
RWU21G-36A RWU 21G-36A NENW 36 070S 220E : 4304733731 .State OW LA
RWU 41-36A RWU 4 l-56A NENE 36 070S 220E | 4304733732 State OW LA
RWU43-16B RWU43-16B NESE 16 070S 230E 4304733733 IState OW LA
RTVLI21-16B RYVU21-16B NENIV 16 070S 230E 4304733754 State Cin' LA
RMTI 11-36A RWU 11-36A NWNW 36 070S 220E 4304733736 State OW LA
RWU 13-36A RWU 13-36A NWSW 36 070S - 220E 4304733737 State OW LA
R1N32Gi-16C RAT32G-16C SVŒ>E: , 16 070S 240E 4304735238 5670 State G\V P
RW 14-36AMU RW 14-36AMU SWSW 36 070S 220E 4304736721 State GW IAPD
RW 01-36BG RW 01-36BG NWNW 36 0708 230E 430475688 5670 State OW S
RW 24-16BG RW 24-16BG SESW 16 070S 230E 4304737746 5670 IState OW DRL
RW 12-32BG RW 12-32BG SWNW 32 070S | 230E 4304737946 15841 State GW

1 of 1 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RWU 51 (12-16B) RW 12-16B SWNW 16 070S 230E 4304715177 5670 State OW P
RWU ST 189 (41-16B) RW 41-16B NENE 16 070S 230E 4304715292 5670 State iOW S
RED WASH UNIT 259 RW 14-16B SWSW 16 070S 230E 4304732785 5670 State OW _ _ P
RED WASH UNIT 260 RW 34-16B SWSE 16 070S 230E 4304732786 5670 State OW P
RWU 324 (23-16B) RW 23-16B SESW 16 070S 230E 4304733084 5670 State WI OPS
RWU 21W-36A _ RWU 21W-36A NENW 36 070S 220E ; 4304733730 State GW LA
RWU21G-36A RWU 21G-36A NENW 36 070S 220E : 4304733731 .State OW LA
RWU 41-36A RWU 4 l-56A NENE 36 070S 220E | 4304733732 State OW LA
RWU43-16B RWU43-16B NESE 16 070S 230E 4304733733 IState OW LA
RTVLI21-16B RYVU21-16B NENIV 16 070S 230E 4304733754 State Cin' LA
RMTI 11-36A RWU 11-36A NWNW 36 070S 220E 4304733736 State OW LA
RWU 13-36A RWU 13-36A NWSW 36 070S - 220E 4304733737 State OW LA
R1N32Gi-16C RAT32G-16C SVŒ>E: , 16 070S 240E 4304735238 5670 State G\V P
RW 14-36AMU RW 14-36AMU SWSW 36 070S 220E 4304736721 State GW IAPD
RW 01-36BG RW 01-36BG NWNW 36 0708 230E 430475688 5670 State OW S
RW 24-16BG RW 24-16BG SESW 16 070S 230E 4304737746 5670 IState OW DRL
RW 12-32BG RW 12-32BG SWNW 32 070S | 230E 4304737946 15841 State GW



STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING S. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

see attached
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 IFINDIAN ALhLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do not use this form for proposals to dritinew wells,significantly deepen existing wells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells,or to
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals. See attached

1. TYPE OF WELL -- -- 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER;OIL WELL [_| GAS WELL [_j OTHER see attached
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR 9. API NUMBER.

QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANY attached
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, ORWILDCAT:
1050 17th Street Suite 500 ,. , Denver sy,,, CO ,80265 (303) 308-3068

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: attached couNTY: Ulntah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart; CASING REPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

1/1/2007 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUGBACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL slTE OTHER: Operator Narne
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Change

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show allpertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective January 1, 2007 operator of record,QEP Uinta Basin, Inc., willhereafter be known as QUESTAR EXPLORATION
AND PRODUCTION COMPANY. Thls name change involves onlyan internal corporate name change and no thirdparty
change of operator is involved. The same employeeswillcontinue to be responsible for operatlonsof theproperties described
on the attached list. AIIoperationswillcontinueto be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLMReference No. ESBOOOO24)
Utah State Bond Number: 965003033 ,

Fee Land Bond Number: 965003033
Current operatorof record, QEP UINTABASIN, IN , hereby r signs as operatorof the properties as described on the
attached list.

Ja es , Executive Vice President, QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
Successor operator of record, QUESTAR EXPLORATIO É PO UCTIONCOMPANY, hereby assumes all rights, duties
and obligations as operator of the propertles as descr ed on the ttachedlist

Jayf. Neese, Exec tiveVice President
Q6estar Explorationand Production Company

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) D rSK. Stanberry ; ) TITLE Supervisor, Regulatory Affalrs

SIGNATI.lRE DATE 3/16/2007

(This spaeo for Stato use only)

RECFVE
APR1 3 2007

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse SIde)

DN.0F0\L,GAS&

STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING S. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

see attached
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 IFINDIAN ALhLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do not use this form for proposals to dritinew wells,significantly deepen existing wells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells,or to
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals. See attached

1. TYPE OF WELL -- -- 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER;OIL WELL [_| GAS WELL [_j OTHER see attached
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR 9. API NUMBER.

QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANY attached
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, ORWILDCAT:
1050 17th Street Suite 500 ,. , Denver sy,,, CO ,80265 (303) 308-3068

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: attached couNTY: Ulntah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart; CASING REPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

1/1/2007 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUGBACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL slTE OTHER: Operator Narne
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Change

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show allpertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective January 1, 2007 operator of record,QEP Uinta Basin, Inc., willhereafter be known as QUESTAR EXPLORATION
AND PRODUCTION COMPANY. Thls name change involves onlyan internal corporate name change and no thirdparty
change of operator is involved. The same employeeswillcontinue to be responsible for operatlonsof theproperties described
on the attached list. AIIoperationswillcontinueto be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLMReference No. ESBOOOO24)
Utah State Bond Number: 965003033 ,

Fee Land Bond Number: 965003033
Current operatorof record, QEP UINTABASIN, IN , hereby r signs as operatorof the properties as described on the
attached list.

Ja es , Executive Vice President, QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
Successor operator of record, QUESTAR EXPLORATIO É PO UCTIONCOMPANY, hereby assumes all rights, duties
and obligations as operator of the propertles as descr ed on the ttachedlist

Jayf. Neese, Exec tiveVice President
Q6estar Explorationand Production Company

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) D rSK. Stanberry ; ) TITLE Supervisor, Regulatory Affalrs

SIGNATI.lRE DATE 3/16/2007

(This spaeo for Stato use only)

RECFVE

APR1 3 2007
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse SIde)

DN.0F0\L,GAS&



STATEOFUTAH FORMS
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GASAND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIAL.NUMBER:
see attached

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 NDAN LhLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do not use thisform for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to See attacheddrill horizontal laterals Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.
1 TYPE OF WELL 6. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER see attached
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR. 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY attached

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT
1050 17th Street Suite 500 Denver sy,,, CO 80265 (303) 308-3068

4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE 8ÍtBChed COUNTY; Ulntah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATECURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTOREPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

1/1/2007 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR
CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK O WATER DISPOSAL(Submit originalForm Only)
CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFFDate of workcompletion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMAflONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Well Name Changes
O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED ORCOMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show allpertinent details including dates, deptils, volurnes,etc.

PER THE ATTACHEDLIST OF WELLS, QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANYREQUESTS THAT THE
INDIVIDUALWELL NAMES BE UPDATED INYOUR RECORDS.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) n , TITLE Supervisor, Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATURE 4/17/2007

(This space for State use only)

RECEfVED
APR18 2007(See instructions on ReverseSide

DN.OF016GAS&MINiNG

STATEOFUTAH FORMS
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GASAND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIAL.NUMBER:
see attached

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 NDAN LhLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do not use thisform for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to See attacheddrill horizontal laterals Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.
1 TYPE OF WELL 6. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER see attached
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR. 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY attached

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT
1050 17th Street Suite 500 Denver sy,,, CO 80265 (303) 308-3068

4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE 8ÍtBChed COUNTY; Ulntah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATECURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTOREPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

1/1/2007 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR
CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK O WATER DISPOSAL(Submit originalForm Only)
CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFFDate of workcompletion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMAflONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Well Name Changes
O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED ORCOMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show allpertinent details including dates, deptils, volurnes,etc.

PER THE ATTACHEDLIST OF WELLS, QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANYREQUESTS THAT THE
INDIVIDUALWELL NAMES BE UPDATED INYOUR RECORDS.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) n , TITLE Supervisor, Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATURE 4/17/2007

(This space for State use only)

RECEfVED
APR18 2007(See instructions on ReverseSide

DN.OF016GAS&MINiNG



United States Department of the Interior
BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT

Utah State Office T^KE PR DE
P.O. Box 45155 "Am emcA

Salt Lake City,UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
UT-922

April 23, 2007

Questar Exploration and Production Company
1050 17th Street, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265

Re: Red Wash Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

On April 12, 2007, we received an indenture dated April 6, 2007, whereby QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
resigned as Unit Operator and Questar Exploration and Production Company was designated as
Successor Unit Operator for the Red Wash Unit,Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effectiveApril23, 2007.
In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the

designated party has obtained all requiredapproval that wouldentitle itto conductoperations under
the Red Wash UnitAgreement.

Yournationwideoiland gas bond No. ESBOOOO24willbe used tocover allfederal operations within
the Red Wash Unit.

It is requested that you notifyall interested parties of the change in unit operator. Copies of the
approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriatefederal offices,with one copy returned
herewith.

Sincerely,

/s/ Greg J. Noble

Greg J. Noble
ActingChief, Branch of FluidMinerals

Enclosure
bcc: Field Manager - Vernal (wlenclosure)

SITLA
Division of Oil,Gas &Mining
File - Red Wash Unit(wlenclosure)
Agr. Sec. Chron ggggivED
Reading File
Central Files ggg 30 2ÛÛÎ

UT922:TAThompson:tt:4/23/07

gy OFOLGAS&

United States Department of the Interior
BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT

Utah State Office T^KE PR DE
P.O. Box 45155 "Am emcA

Salt Lake City,UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
UT-922

April 23, 2007

Questar Exploration and Production Company
1050 17th Street, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265

Re: Red Wash Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

On April 12, 2007, we received an indenture dated April 6, 2007, whereby QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
resigned as Unit Operator and Questar Exploration and Production Company was designated as
Successor Unit Operator for the Red Wash Unit,Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effectiveApril23, 2007.
In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the

designated party has obtained all requiredapproval that wouldentitle itto conductoperations under
the Red Wash UnitAgreement.

Yournationwideoiland gas bond No. ESBOOOO24willbe used tocover allfederal operations within
the Red Wash Unit.

It is requested that you notifyall interested parties of the change in unit operator. Copies of the
approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriatefederal offices,with one copy returned
herewith.

Sincerely,

/s/ Greg J. Noble

Greg J. Noble
ActingChief, Branch of FluidMinerals

Enclosure
bcc: Field Manager - Vernal (wlenclosure)
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/14/2010

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N5085-QuestarExploration and Production Company N3700-QEP Energy Company

1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265

Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048 Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048

CA No. Unit: RED WASH
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

NO TYPE STATUSSEE ATTACHED

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/28/2010
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/28/2010
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/24/20104a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Requested
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 8/16/2010 BIA not yet7. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 8/16/2010

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 6/29/2010

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/30/2010
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/30/2010
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESBOOOO24
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965010693
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965010695
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a
COMMENTS:

QEP Energy (Red Wash) FORM A.xls

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOFNATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS ANDMINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER
See attached

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS See attached
T UNIT or CAAGREEMENT NAME:Do not use this form for proposals to drill newwells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° See attacheddrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILL form forsuch proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL 8 WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL D GAS WELL OTHER See attached
2 NUOMEOFO

Xplor tion and Production Company $$ tt
chM &

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:
1050 17th Street, Suite 500 Denver

, ,, CO z,80265 (303) 672-6900 See attached
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: See attached COUNTY: Attached

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE.MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICEOF INTENT
(Suomit m Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

6/14/2010 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFFDate of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: Operator Name
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENTFORMATION Change

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective June 14, 2010 Questar Exploration and Production Company changed its name to QEP Energy Company. This name
change involves only an internal corporate name change and no thirdparty change of operator is involved. The same
employees will continue to be responsible for operations of the properties described on the attached list. All operations will
continue to be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLM Reference No. ESBOOOO24)
Utah State Bond Number: 965666683
Fee Land Bond Number: ¾5063683··
BIABondNumber: 79944& $#$~0/Oto

3
The attached document is an all inclusive list of the wells operated by Questar Exploration and Production Company. As of
June 14, 2010 QEP Energy Company assumes all rights, duties and obligations as operator of the properties as described onthe list

NAME(PLEASE P Morgan Anderson vivo Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATUR ) i DATE 6/23/2010

(This space for State use only)

RECElVED APPROVED /2
(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side)

ÛÎVÎSlon of Oil,GasandMintDIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING Earlene Russell, Engineering
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Questar ExplorationProduction Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
RED WASH

efectiveJune 14,2010

well name see twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease10%T41-33B 33 070S 230E 4304720060 5670 Federed EnD AIUgr43-28A 28 070S 220E 4304730058 5670 Federed TVD A

RW 34-27B 27 070S 230E 4304715142 5670 Federal WI ARNVl4-13B 13 070S 230E 4304715144 5670 Federed TVI AFUN41-20B 20 070S 230E 4304715146 5670 Federal TVI At10%T21-23B 23 070S 230E 4304715151 5670 Federed TVI AIUM/23-14B 14 070S 230E 4304715161 5670 Federed TVI AIUMT41-28B 28 070S 230E 4304715182 5670 Federed TVI AIUM/23-18B 18 070S 230E 4304715210 5670 Federed TVI AftW43-2LA 21 070S 220E 4304715219 5670 Federed TVI AICAT41-24A 24 070S 220E 4304715221 5670 Federed TVI ARTVl3-ZD3 22 070S 230E 4304715261 5670 Federed TVI AR3W23-15B 15 070S 230E 4304715267 5670 Federal TVI ARET21-20B 20 070S 230E 4304715281 5670 Federed Vil ARTV33-13B 13 070S 230E 4304715289 5670 Federal TVI ARM/21-34A 34 070S 220E 4304715303 5670 Federed TVI I
RNV14-24B 24 070S 230E 4304716472 5670 Federed TVI A10W'41-27B 27 070S 230E 4304716473 5670 Federed TVI Ipgr43-:2.8B 28 070S 230E 4304716475 5670 Federed TVI SRAV23-23B 23 070S 230E 4304716476 5670 Federed TVI A
RTV12-24B 24 070S 230E 4304716477 5670 Federal TVI AICW'33-2]D3 22 070S 230E 4304716479 5670 Federed TVI AFUN41-21B 21 070S 230E 4304716482 5670 Federal TVI A]Ryr41-15B 15 070S 230E 4304716495 5670 Federal TVI IIUMT21-21B 21 070S 230E 4304716496 5670 Federed VVI ARNVl4-:21B 21 070S 230E 4304716497 5670 Federed TVI ARV/41-14B 14 070S 230E 4304716498 5670 Federed TVI A
RW 21-27A 27 070S 220E 4304730103 5670 Federal WI AIUV734-22/t 22 070S 220E|4304730458 5670 Federal TVI A10W'24-26B 26 070S 230E 4304730518 5670 Federed TVI I
RVV31-35B 35 070S 230E 4304730519 5670 Federal TVI AICuf33-26B 26 070S 230E 4304730521 5670 Federed TVI I
IUW13-26B 26 070S 230E 4304730522 5670 Federal TVI ARNV11-36B 36 070S 230E 4304731052 5670 Federed TVI AICAT31-26B 26 070S 230E 4304731077 5670 Federal 1¥I ARTV42-35B 35 070S 230E 4304731081 5670 Federed )VI I
RW 23-17B 17 070S 230E 4304732739 5670 Federal WI ARM/43-17B 17 070S 230E 4304732980 5670 Federal VVI AIUgr43-18B 18 070S 230E 4304732982 5670 Federed TVI A
RNV13-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733497 5670 Federed TVI ARNV13-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733498 5670 Federal 3VI A10%733-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733499 5670 Federal TVI AIUn'33-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733500 5670 Federed TVI A i

RW 11-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733552 5670 Federal WI A
Bonds:BLAñ=ESBOOOO24

BIA= 956010693
State=965010695 1 of
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Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
RED WASH

efectiveJune 14,2010

well name see twp rng entity mineral type tat C
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Bonds:BLAñ= ESBOOOO24
BIA=956010693

State= 965010695 2 of
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United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
TAKE PFittoE+

NCH µ¢ Utah State Office INAMER ICA
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
http://www.blm.gov/ut/st/en.html

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3100
(UT-922)

JUL2 &2010

Memorandum

Fr m:

1Frield Office PeriaceFie ce Mo Fi

Subject: Name Change Recognized

Attached is a copy of the Certificate of Name Change issued by the Texas Secretary of State and
a decision letter recognizing the name change from the Fastern States Office. We have updated
our records to reflect the name change in the attached list of leases.

The name change from QuestarExploration and Production Company into QEP Energy
Company is effective June 8, 2010.

cc: MMS

United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
TAKE PFittoE+

NCH µ¢ Utah State Office INAMER ICA
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
http://www.blm.gov/ut/st/en.html

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3100
(UT-922)

JUL2 &2010

Memorandum

Fr m:

1Frield Office PeriaceFie ce Mo Fi

Subject: Name Change Recognized

Attached is a copy of the Certificate of Name Change issued by the Texas Secretary of State and
a decision letter recognizing the name change from the Fastern States Office. We have updated
our records to reflect the name change in the attached list of leases.

The name change from QuestarExploration and Production Company into QEP Energy
Company is effective June 8, 2010.

cc: MMS



STATE OF UTAH UICFORM 5
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING

TRANSFER OF AUTHORITY TO INJECT
Well Name and Number API Number
See Attached List Attached

Location of Well Field or Unit Name
Attached

Footage : Attached County :
Lease Designation and Number

QQ, Section, Township, Range: State : UTAH Attached

EFFECTIVE DATE OF TRANSFER: 6/14/2010

CURRENT OPERATOR

Company: Questar Exploration and Production Company Name: gn P

Address: 1050 17th Street, Suite 500 Signatur :

city Denver state CO zio 80265 Title: ngine ring Analyst

Phone: (303) 672-6900 Date: 6/28/2910

Comments:

NEW OPERATOR

.
QEP Energy Company Name:Company.

Address: 1050 17th Street, Suite 500 signatu .

city Denver state CO zio 80265 Title: Engineeri g Analyst

Phone: (303) 672-6900 Date: 6/28/201

Comments:

(This space for State use only)

Transfer approved by Approva te

Comments: Oil, Gas and Mining
Date: I

gy
By: y RECEIVED

(5/2000> JUN2 8 2010

DIV.0F0\L,GAS&

STATE OF UTAH UICFORM 5
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING

TRANSFER OF AUTHORITY TO INJECT
Well Name and Number API Number
See Attached List Attached
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Footage : Attached County :
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(This space for State use only)

Transfer approved by Approva te

Comments: Oil, Gas and Mining
Date: I

gy
By: y RECEIVED

(5/2000> JUN2 8 2010

DIV.0F0\L,GAS&



O
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESlGNAT]ONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTU-081
6. 1FINDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do notuse this form for proposals to drill new wells,significantlydeepen existingwellsbelow currentbottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells,or to RED WASH UNITdrillhor¡zontal laterals. Use APPLlCATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPEOFWELL

OILWELL GASWELL OTHER WATER INJECTION WELL 8 WEWLLN3AM2E2andNUMBER:

2. NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

QEP ENERGY COMPANY 4304715261
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WlLDCAT:
11002 E. 17500 S. egy VERNAL STATE UT ZIP84078 (435) 781-4342 RED WASH

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 2073' FSL, 660' FWL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MER]DIAN: NWSW 22 7S 23E S STATE:
UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

AClDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT S1DETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVlOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DiŠPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOFWELLSITE OTHER: MIT INTEGRITY11/2/2010 O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Started working on this well on 10/22/10 to do MITIntegrity Test.

1 - RU WL & RIH w/ sinker bars to EOT of each string @ 5501' &5625'. RIH w/ jet cutter &cut 2-3/8" short string @ 5468' &
cut long string @5457'. Both strings pulled free.
2 - Finish POOH & laying down 177 jts 2-3/8" tbg &20' cut off jt f/ short string. Total = 5451'. POOH laying down 177 jts 2-3/8"
tbg & 9' cut-off jt fl long string. Total = 5432'. Change out BOP rarns to 2-7/8".
3 - RIH w/ 7" Arrowset - 1 pkr, 1 Jt 2-7/8" tbg, SN, 174 jts tbg & 1-8' x 2-7/8" tbg pup. EOT @5471'.
4 - Set pkr @ 5468'. NU WH. Test csg to 1150 psi. Lost 75 psi - OK.

Finished the work on 11/2/10. AcceMedW* RECElVED
M Divisionofmaassagginins DEC23 2010

ygRRECORDONLY DIV.0F OlL,GAS&MINING

NAME (PL SE PR ) Dahp Caldwell TITLE Office Administrator

SIGNATURE DATE 12/17/2010

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse

O
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESlGNAT]ONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTU-081
6. 1FINDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
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Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVlOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DiŠPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOFWELLSITE OTHER: MIT INTEGRITY11/2/2010 O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Started working on this well on 10/22/10 to do MITIntegrity Test.

1 - RU WL & RIH w/ sinker bars to EOT of each string @ 5501' &5625'. RIH w/ jet cutter &cut 2-3/8" short string @ 5468' &
cut long string @5457'. Both strings pulled free.
2 - Finish POOH & laying down 177 jts 2-3/8" tbg &20' cut off jt f/ short string. Total = 5451'. POOH laying down 177 jts 2-3/8"
tbg & 9' cut-off jt fl long string. Total = 5432'. Change out BOP rarns to 2-7/8".
3 - RIH w/ 7" Arrowset - 1 pkr, 1 Jt 2-7/8" tbg, SN, 174 jts tbg & 1-8' x 2-7/8" tbg pup. EOT @5471'.
4 - Set pkr @ 5468'. NU WH. Test csg to 1150 psi. Lost 75 psi - OK.

Finished the work on 11/2/10. AcceMedW* RECElVED
M Divisionofmaassagginins DEC23 2010

ygRRECORDONLY DIV.0F OlL,GAS&MINING

NAME (PL SE PR ) Dahp Caldwell TITLE Office Administrator

SIGNATURE DATE 12/17/2010

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



RECEIVED
QEP ENERGY DEC2 3 2010 Page 1 of 2

Operations Summary Reporfiv- GF0ft, GAS&MINING

Well Name: RWU 13-22B Spud Date: 2/21/1961
Location: 22-7-S 23-E 1 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ROCKY MTN WS Rig Number: 3

SubDate From - To Hours Code Code Description of Operations

10/22/2010 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION
07:00 - 15:00 8.00 LOC 4 ROAD RIG TO LOCATION. RIG UP WELL SERVICE UNIT & CIRC EQUIPMENT

TO REPAIR CSG LEAK. LEAVE WELL OPEN TO FLOWBACK TANK.
15:00 - 16:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY

10/25/2010 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION SICP= 0 PSI FTP = 0 PSI
07:00 - 12:00 5.00 WHD 2 NIP DN TREE. BOLTS & TOP FLANGE RUSTED TOGETHER.
12:00 - 15:30 3.50 FISH 6 WORK BOTH STRINGS OF 2 3/8" INJECTION TBG. TRY TO RELEASE LATCH

ASSY FI7" PKR @5484 WI NO SUCCESS. SWIFN
15:30 - 17:00 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY

10/26/2010 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION SITP= 0 PSI, SICP= 0 PSI
07:00 -11:00 4.00 FISH 6 WORK STUCK TBG. TRY TO RELEASE TBG LATCH ON SHORT STRING @

5474' W/ NO SUCCESS.
11:00 - 14:00 3.00 FISH 4 RIH WI 1 13/16" WIRELINE TOOLS, BUT TAGGED HEAVY OIL @ 300' & 800' IN

BOTH STRINGS
14:00 - 15:00 1.00 HOT 1 PUMP 230 DEGREE CHEMICAL WATER DN BOTH STRINGS OF 2 3/8" INJ

TBG.
15:00 - 17:00 2.00 FISH 4 RIH W/ 1 13/16" WIRELINE SPUD TOOLS & CCL TO EOT OF LONG STRING &

SHORT STRINGS. POOH & SWIFN
17:00 - 18:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY

10/27/2010 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION. SICP= 0 PSI ,
SITP= 0 PSI

07:00 - 10:00 3.00 HOT 1 R/U HOT-OILER & PUMP 15 BBLS 230 DEGREE CHEMICAL WATER DN
SHORT STRING & LONG STRING.

10:00 -14:00 4.00 LOG 4 R/U WIRELINE & RIH W/ SINKER BARS TO EOT OF EACH STRING @ 5501' &
5625' RIH WI JET CUTTER & CUT 2 3/8" SHORT STRING @5468' & CUT LONG
STRING @ 5457' BOTH STRINGS PULLED FREE. R/D WIRELINE.

14:00 - 15:00 1.00 BOP 1 NIU BOP & RIG UP FLOOR.
15:00 - 17:00 2.00 TRP 5 POOH LAYING DN 80 JTS 2 3/8" SHORT STRING TO 3068' SWIFN
17:00 - 18:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY

10/28/2010 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION SICP= 0 PSI ,
SITP= 0 PSI

07:00 - 15:00 8.00 TRP 5 FINISH POOH LAYlNG DN 177 JTS 2 3/8" TBG & 20' CUT-OFF JT FI SHORT
STRING. TOTAL=5451' POOH LAYING DN 177 JTS 2 3/8" TBG & 9' CUT-OFF
JT FI LONG STRING. TOTAL = 5432'

15:00 - 16:00 1.00 BOP 1 CHANGE OUT BOP RAMS TO 2 7/8". CHANGE HANDLINGTOOLS TO 2 7/8".
16:00 - 17:00 1.00 TRP 5 P/U & RIH WI7" PKR, SN & 2 7/8" J-55 TBG TO 650'. SWIFN
17:00 - 18:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY

10/29/2010 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION. SICP= 0 PSI ,
SITP= 0 PSI

07:00 - 11:00 4.00 TRP 5 FINISH RIH PICKING UP 2 7/8" J-55 INT COATED TBG WI SN &
WEATHERFORD 7" MODEL "32-A" PKR.

11:00 - 12:30 1.50 EQT 1 SET PKR @541T & PRESS TEST 7" CSG TO 1000 PSI / 60 MIN. FINAL
PRESS=980 PSI. RELEASE PKR

12:30 - 15:00 2.50 TRP 2 POOH WI TBG & LAY DOWN PKR. SWIFWE
15:00 - 16:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY

11/1/2010 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION SITP= 0 PSI ,
SICP= 0 PSI

07:00 - 10:00 3.00 FISH 5 P/U & RIH W/ FISHING TOOLS. TAG FISHTOP @5457'.
10:00 - 12:00 2.00 STIM 1 SPOT 500 GAL. 15 % HCL @ FISHTOP. PULL UP 300' &WAIT 1-HR.
12:00 - 14:00 2.00 FISH 5 RIH & DRESS OFF FISHTOP @545T. ENGAGE FISH & JAR FREE IN 2 HITS.
14:00 -15:30 1.50 TRP 2 POOH WI FISHING TOOLS & ALL FISH REMAINING IN WELL.
15:30 -17:00 1.50 TRP 4 LAY DN FISHING TOOLS & FISH. (2-7" PKRS, 2-F NIPPLES, BAKER LATCH

SUB, 4 JTS 2 3/8" TBG, 2-HYDRO TRIP SUBS & CUT-OFF JTS TBG.) SWIFN
17:00 - 18:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY

11/2/2010 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION SICP= 0 PSI
07:00 - 09:30 2.50 TRP 2 RIH WI7" ARROWSET-1 PKR, 1 JT 2\7|8' BG SN, 174 JTS 2 7/8" TBG & 1-8'X

2 7/8" TBG PUP.

Printed: 12/21/2010 1:13:58

RECEIVED
QEP ENERGY DEC2 3 2010 Page 1 of 2

Operations Summary Reporfiv- GF0ft, GAS&MINING

Well Name: RWU 13-22B Spud Date: 2/21/1961
Location: 22-7-S 23-E 1 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ROCKY MTN WS Rig Number: 3

SubDate From - To Hours Code Code Description of Operations

10/22/2010 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION
07:00 - 15:00 8.00 LOC 4 ROAD RIG TO LOCATION. RIG UP WELL SERVICE UNIT & CIRC EQUIPMENT

TO REPAIR CSG LEAK. LEAVE WELL OPEN TO FLOWBACK TANK.
15:00 - 16:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY

10/25/2010 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION SICP= 0 PSI FTP = 0 PSI
07:00 - 12:00 5.00 WHD 2 NIP DN TREE. BOLTS & TOP FLANGE RUSTED TOGETHER.
12:00 - 15:30 3.50 FISH 6 WORK BOTH STRINGS OF 2 3/8" INJECTION TBG. TRY TO RELEASE LATCH

ASSY FI7" PKR @5484 WI NO SUCCESS. SWIFN
15:30 - 17:00 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY

10/26/2010 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION SITP= 0 PSI, SICP= 0 PSI
07:00 -11:00 4.00 FISH 6 WORK STUCK TBG. TRY TO RELEASE TBG LATCH ON SHORT STRING @

5474' W/ NO SUCCESS.
11:00 - 14:00 3.00 FISH 4 RIH WI 1 13/16" WIRELINE TOOLS, BUT TAGGED HEAVY OIL @ 300' & 800' IN

BOTH STRINGS
14:00 - 15:00 1.00 HOT 1 PUMP 230 DEGREE CHEMICAL WATER DN BOTH STRINGS OF 2 3/8" INJ

TBG.
15:00 - 17:00 2.00 FISH 4 RIH W/ 1 13/16" WIRELINE SPUD TOOLS & CCL TO EOT OF LONG STRING &

SHORT STRINGS. POOH & SWIFN
17:00 - 18:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY

10/27/2010 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION. SICP= 0 PSI ,
SITP= 0 PSI

07:00 - 10:00 3.00 HOT 1 R/U HOT-OILER & PUMP 15 BBLS 230 DEGREE CHEMICAL WATER DN
SHORT STRING & LONG STRING.

10:00 -14:00 4.00 LOG 4 R/U WIRELINE & RIH W/ SINKER BARS TO EOT OF EACH STRING @ 5501' &
5625' RIH WI JET CUTTER & CUT 2 3/8" SHORT STRING @5468' & CUT LONG
STRING @ 5457' BOTH STRINGS PULLED FREE. R/D WIRELINE.

14:00 - 15:00 1.00 BOP 1 NIU BOP & RIG UP FLOOR.
15:00 - 17:00 2.00 TRP 5 POOH LAYING DN 80 JTS 2 3/8" SHORT STRING TO 3068' SWIFN
17:00 - 18:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY

10/28/2010 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION SICP= 0 PSI ,
SITP= 0 PSI

07:00 - 15:00 8.00 TRP 5 FINISH POOH LAYlNG DN 177 JTS 2 3/8" TBG & 20' CUT-OFF JT FI SHORT
STRING. TOTAL=5451' POOH LAYING DN 177 JTS 2 3/8" TBG & 9' CUT-OFF
JT FI LONG STRING. TOTAL = 5432'

15:00 - 16:00 1.00 BOP 1 CHANGE OUT BOP RAMS TO 2 7/8". CHANGE HANDLINGTOOLS TO 2 7/8".
16:00 - 17:00 1.00 TRP 5 P/U & RIH WI7" PKR, SN & 2 7/8" J-55 TBG TO 650'. SWIFN
17:00 - 18:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY

10/29/2010 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION. SICP= 0 PSI ,
SITP= 0 PSI

07:00 - 11:00 4.00 TRP 5 FINISH RIH PICKING UP 2 7/8" J-55 INT COATED TBG WI SN &
WEATHERFORD 7" MODEL "32-A" PKR.

11:00 - 12:30 1.50 EQT 1 SET PKR @541T & PRESS TEST 7" CSG TO 1000 PSI / 60 MIN. FINAL
PRESS=980 PSI. RELEASE PKR

12:30 - 15:00 2.50 TRP 2 POOH WI TBG & LAY DOWN PKR. SWIFWE
15:00 - 16:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY

11/1/2010 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION SITP= 0 PSI ,
SICP= 0 PSI

07:00 - 10:00 3.00 FISH 5 P/U & RIH W/ FISHING TOOLS. TAG FISHTOP @5457'.
10:00 - 12:00 2.00 STIM 1 SPOT 500 GAL. 15 % HCL @ FISHTOP. PULL UP 300' &WAIT 1-HR.
12:00 - 14:00 2.00 FISH 5 RIH & DRESS OFF FISHTOP @545T. ENGAGE FISH & JAR FREE IN 2 HITS.
14:00 -15:30 1.50 TRP 2 POOH WI FISHING TOOLS & ALL FISH REMAINING IN WELL.
15:30 -17:00 1.50 TRP 4 LAY DN FISHING TOOLS & FISH. (2-7" PKRS, 2-F NIPPLES, BAKER LATCH

SUB, 4 JTS 2 3/8" TBG, 2-HYDRO TRIP SUBS & CUT-OFF JTS TBG.) SWIFN
17:00 - 18:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY

11/2/2010 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION SICP= 0 PSI
07:00 - 09:30 2.50 TRP 2 RIH WI7" ARROWSET-1 PKR, 1 JT 2\7|8' BG SN, 174 JTS 2 7/8" TBG & 1-8'X

2 7/8" TBG PUP.

Printed: 12/21/2010 1:13:58



QEP ENERGY Page 2 of 2

Operations Summary Report

Well Name:RWU 13-22B Spud Date: 2/21/1961
Location: 22- 7-S 23-E 1 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ROCKY MTN WS Rig Number: 3

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

11/2/2010 09:30 - 10:30 1.00 BOP 1 NID BOP
10:30 - 12:30 2.00 CIRC 4 CIRC 165 BBLS PKR FLUID DN CSG.
12:30 - 16:00 3.50 DEQ 2 SET PKR @ 5468.02' & N/U WELLHEAD. TEST CSG TO 1150 PSI / 30 MIN.

LOST 75 PSI-OK. SHUT-IN WELL
16:00 - 17:30 1.50 LOC 4 RIG DOWN & MOVE OFF LOCATION.
17:30 - 19:00 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY

RECEIVED
DEC23 2010

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING

Printed: 12/21/2010 1:13:58
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RECEIVED: Sep. 01, 2016

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-081 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 RED WASH 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Water Injection Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 RW 13-22B 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047152610000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 595-5919  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 RED WASH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2073 FSL 0660 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSW Section: 22 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

9 /1 /2016

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 This sundry is to inform you that QEP Energy Company resumed
injection on the above mentioned well on 09/01/2016.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Jan Nelson 435 781-4331

TITLE
 Permit Agent

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 9 /1 /2016

September 02, 2016

Sundry Number: 74127 API Well Number: 43047152610000Sundry Number: 74127 API Well Number: 43047152610000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-os1

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. RED WASH

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Water Injection Well RW 13-22B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047152610000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 595-5919 Ext RED WASH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

2073 FSL 0660 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWSW Section: 22 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

9 / 1/2 0 16
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

This sundry is to inform you that QEP Energy Company resumed Accepted by the
injection on the above mentioned well on 09/01/2016. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
September 02, 2016

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jan Nelson 435 781-4331 Permit Agent

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 9/1/2016

RECEIVED: Sep. 01,
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