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SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
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WELL NO.: Lk1LB(8L) PROPERI‘I. Section 1B RED WASH FISLD
‘WORK DONE
0% - 32¢ 16" conductor

June 8, 1958, cemented 32! 16" conductor pipe using L5 sacks SK regular cemont
by hand.

Kerr McGee 01l Industries moved in and rigged up.

Supped June 9, 19583
' Drilled 157 hole with Hughes 0SC 3, water drilling fluid.
320 - 3120 280  drilled.

Cemented 287 10 v, 40.5#, J=55 casin at 02' '

urton sacks common csmen CaClp. Cemented 287% 20. 3/4" casing
at 302!, 20 minutes mixing and pumping ¢cement to place. Displaced with 26 barrels of
water. Good circulation throughout. Good cement returns to surface.

asing Deta.il
amp I Jts, 287" 10 3/k%, 10.5#, J-55 New Seanless
‘ ' fitted on bottom with Baker Guide
Shoa.
Total 7 jts. 287¢ ,
" K.B. to top of 10 3/h* casing %Es { r
- Cemented @ ‘ 3 :

June 10, thra June 11, 1958
‘Drilling 'fluj.d.tater. |
Bit changed to 9 7/8" Hughés OCS 3 |

3120 - 29091 2897'  drilled. 9 7/8% hole

.d-----ﬂ-n&------’---'u—--‘----------ﬂ-‘-ﬂ--i

June 12, 1958 thru June 13, 1958 .
Changed. drilling fluid to gel mud with 15% lost circulation material.

2909¢ - 3329  }20¢ drilled. 9 7/8* hole

-’-,-------------~‘-“I~----—-—_ ------- - em e W ad W o

- June 1k, 1958 . :
3329 - 3}88% 561 drilled with gel mud containing 16% lost cireulation mater;!.al.
,_ 314850 « 3490 - 15¢ drilled with out retums. Lost returns @ 34851,

3lgor - 35655 75° drilled with half to full returns.
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WELL NOo: LL=1LB(8L) PROPERTY: Section 1LB RED WASH FIELD
June 15, 1958 thru June 19, 1958
Drilling fluid gel mud containing 30% lost eirculation waterial.
35651 - W5L0Y  975¢ drilled,

B G W AY B g o G G R WS G NS W ap T en e T R GO oy e - G En MR M A SR G5 Y W B W AP WD WM W U W e e

\

June 20, 1958
150t - L6200 802 drilled.

Twisted off. Left 18 drill collars and 30 joints of pipe in hole. Recovered the
8aM6 o .

620 - 4668t 489 drilled.

June 21, 1958 thru July 3, 1958
Drilling fluid gel mud containing 5 to 25% lost circulation material.
- 146680 - 5920' 13520 drilled. 9 7/8% hole

Ran Schlumberger Induction-Electric Log, recorded 3050 - 5912' (checked bottcm 5918')
and ¥ircrolog Capiler Survey Log, recorded 2500' - 5918¢, Markers: Top Green River
30131 ugh h638' nnn h868' npl 501‘50 nJn 5333c ngn 51‘580 npn 5690a°

~b*ﬂ-ﬂ---------¢.-- ----- @ an W0 @8 G Wb WS G G0 G W W w» W e AN am S

July L, 1958

e ) ' ve
Took L5 minute intial CIP, 10 minute flow, and L5 minute final GIP., Good ateady blow
during flow period. No gas to surface. Recovered 50° oil, 120% oil cut mud, and
326 mud cut water. (3.1 ohm/meters, mud 3.8 ohm/meters). Bottom Chart okay,

PRESSURES 2 |
‘ IH IcIP I FF FCIP

Top 2885 1705 126 173 - 2865
2913 1730 157 1L 2913

ST #2 = 10 ninute HFT of interval 563! - 5920'. (Attempted to test 5638 - 5682 for

ssyre data.)
Moved up Li* when fluld started dropping around packers. Then bottom packer failed.
Ran tools as before. Took 45 minute SI, 10 minute flow, and L5 minute final SI.
Initial CIP no good due to packer failure. Recovered 110' oil and 966* gassy oily
mid bscoming increcasingly oil cut toward bottom. Had good blow. Cas to surface

after tool closed

PRESSURES: IH Ir FF CIP FH
* Top 2885 310 y72 170 2885

Bottom . 2915 340 505 1707 289



Page L

WELL NOs LL~1LB(8L) FROPERTY: Section 1iB RED WASH FIELD
IST #3 - 1 hour 3 minute HFT of interval 5566-5650!. .
a6 before, Set packers ab 5501', bboo! and 5650%. Took 45 minute SI,

flowed 1 hour 3 mimites, and took 45 minute final 8I, Had medium strong blow. Gas
to surface in LS minutes. Recovered 850! total rise, Top 350' oil, bottom 500°
oily gassy, mud (4337 in IOS) becoming very watery in bottom 200°,

PRESSURES s IH ICIP . IF FF FCIP FH
- 2860 - 1987 150 323 17h0 2800
2890  20L 205 360 1768 2890

~ July 5, 1958 | o |

5L = 592015 ‘ .
eohed to test interval S04 - 50837 For pressure data but bottom packer failed.)
Ran sidewall anchor tool. 'Set packers at 56487, 5654¢ and 5668'. Took 15 minute
initial SI, 10 minute flow, and LS minute final SI, Good strong blow when tool
opened, Gas to surface in 7 minutes after tool clesed. Recovered 757! very oily,
gassy, mud. Bottom ohart indicated packer failed sbout 10 minutes after start

of initial CIP test. : ,

DST #; - 10 minute HFT inte
- o g r" "~

PRESSURES ¢ IH ICIP Ir FF FCIP FH
—_ 2900  1690* 175 298 1740' 2900 * Initial CIP
2890  168L 360 480 1730 2890  indicated
before lower
packer failed, -
Jaly 6, 1958 ‘

Cemented 7", 23#, J-55 casing at 5920%,

Cemented 7V casﬁ at 59207 E'By drill pipe and s_chlumbeger measurements) using 550
sacks common cement with 8 Zandmer permeators per foot 5651% - 56614, S = 56757,
56785688, 5718-5728, 5731=57h1, S7L5-5%50, 5754~5759, 5762-5767, ST11-5776, 571719~
876k, ©788-5793, 5805-5807, 5821-5826, 5629-563ls, Porty-five mimrtes mixing cement
to average 15#/gal slurry and 45 minutes displacing witk cementerd equipment

One hour forth-three minutes overall. Cement in place L:18 p.m. Mixed 100 cubic
feet Magnesium oxychloride cement to follow regular cement. However, cement
appeared to be setting too rapidly for safe use and was dumped. Displaced cement
with 60 bbl acetic acid separated from balance of displacing fluid (mud) by rubber
plug, Used two additional rubber plugs. First was designed to separate oxychdoride
which was not used from portland cement and open perforations in Rector cement
collar. Second plug to ssat in Rector stall collar at 58517 providing positive stop
and back pressure check, Pressure increased from 1250 psi to 1600 psi when plug |
bumped. Pressured up to 2250 psi to open permeators when hole began taking fluid
and circulating. Displaced one bbl and released pressure. Held okay. One bbl
bled back, Had full circulation, pipe free, and moved over 30¢ interval except
last 1l minutes of displacing.
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VELL NO.s Ll=14B(BL) PROPERTY: Section 1{;13 - RED WASH FIELD
Casing Detail: _ _
Bottem - 1 Jt or 2,02*  HOWCO Flt shée (59137 - 59207)
Next 1 jt or " 15.30¢ Ractor cement collar (5871 = 5913%)
Next S N1 or lxl i s 234, J=5%, 8rd L T&C New Youngstom
: seamless (5871 - 5913*)
Next 136 or 2.15* 7"y 23f, J-55, Brd & T4 pup Joint
Next,t 15t 18,15¢ (5862:;#.. ggsvé')ard 8 T&0 J int
or : e ’ ) pup o
' | o B v
Next . 13t or 0071° Rector stall collar (5850' - 5851¢)
Next 2 Jts or 1ho11¢ 5 23f, J=55, 8rd blank pups (5836° =~ 5850°)
Next 2 jts or 17.18¢ 5 234, gESg permeator sections
! - 3 ]
Next 134 o 10,00* » 20.30#, J-SS blank pup (5809 - 5819¢)
Next 13t or 8.57! s 20. J=55 permeator section
3} 5800+ 2893
Next 1t or 5.00' 7", 20,304, J-55 blank pup (5795¢ - 5800?)
Next 6 jts or 51.60' 7%, 20,30f, J-55 permeator sections (8.6!.
, cveran each) (S57hlt « 5795¢)
Next 2 Jis or 27,201 s 20.30f, J-55 permeator sections (13.6!
- T overall each) (5716¢ ~ 57LL*) |
Next - 13t or 27.208 v, 20,304, J-55 blank pup (5689% - 57161)
Next 3t or k.74 7%, 20,304, J-55 permeator sections (13.6¢
ot o each) {5649 - 5689°7)
Next 1 jt or 23.03° 7n 20.30#, J~55 blank pup (5626' - 56L91)
Next 132 jts or 5590.02° s 20.30#, J=55, 6rd S T&O New Younga-
tuwn seamless
Next 13t or 6,923 s 20.30§, J55 blank pup
Top 15t or L3.49° s 20.30#, J=55, 8rd S T4 New. Younga-
_ .tm gseamless
ij. ) 160 Ju ot m’ 59351,1)4“ ] : '
Abm Ko Bq N i , ' ’ )
Cemented @ 5?3&!&' Depth of shoe = 12? deeper than Schlum-
: ' berger and drill pipe. All permsator
oz sithue 896 or 13,6' overall and
include 5¢ and 10° of psmasacr's
(8 per foot). , )
July 7, 19568 .

Kerr McGee oil Industries Inc. rig ralea,sed 12:00 noon.

July 11, 1958
R&R Well Service moved rig on location.
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WELL NO.: Lh=14B(8L) PROPERTY: Section 14B RED WASH FIELD

July 12, 1958

Made up additional tubing. Pushed plug to stall collar at 5863¢ (checks casing
measurements). Reversed out acetic acid. Ran MeCullough Gamma Ray-Collar Logo
Checked Schlumberger L' shallow,5800% McCullough equals 5804° Schlumberger. Checked
collars §4' shallower than by casing tally which was 12! deeper than drill.pipe @nd
Schlumberger measurements. Therefore, collars with respect to Schlumberger ar 12°
lower than programmed. Permeators are located 5663% ~ 5673%, 5677-56877, 5690-5700¢,
57301-5740%, 5743-5753¢, 5757=57621, 5766-5771t, ST7Th~57791, 5783-5788" 5791-5796'
5800-58051, 581}4-5819' 5833-5839' SBhl-SBhé' Schlumberger measurementso

-«a-----u-.a-'p—-—---—--—--—---—--—-u——--——--c-

July 13, 1958

Ran Baker retrievable cementer on tubing and set at 5620' Attempted to pump Rangely
crude out through permeators. Went to 5000 psi on tubing (Dowell truck) and held 1000
psi on annulus. Formation would not take fiuid.

Spusted 1000 gallons of Dowell Unhibited HCL acid through open end tubing hanging
at 58l§7. Displaced acid fram tubing with 29 bbls Rangely crude. (Acid spotted to
acidize core out of permeators) Used a rubber wiper plug between acid and oil.,
Pulled tubing up 700" to clear acid. Shut well in for night while acid pitkled.

‘»noﬁﬂﬁﬂc.‘---ﬂ&-----bb---——‘-‘-u--.—----’-—-ﬂ-

July lh, 1958

Ran tubing to bottam and reversed out acid. Ran Baker EGJ packer. Set at 56207,
Displa¢ed oil thru permeators. Formation took fluid at L bbls per minute at 3500 psi.
Ejected balls with Zandmer bottom hole ball dropping device. Attempted: £o drop 60
balls, -

------,n—---..------&-------—----n-m—---—~-~m

With. Baker Ml bore retainer set at 5620' above Zandmer bottom hole ba.ll dropping
device, -displaced 100 bbls Rangely crude treated with If surfactant. Attempbed to
drop balls at the rate of 1 ball per bbl. Pulled out. Found 138 balls had: been -
released. Had no indications that mny balls seated. Ran tubing and acraper t0 ¢lean
out balls.

Acnd-.t--w--n--—-”--—--“-‘---—-‘----—0--’-“---‘.

July 16 1958

- Sand-oil squeezed through permeators. Used 3 Dowell trucks to’ squeeze down the- casing.
Broke dowm through permeators at 2700 psi. Pumped in 25 bbls burner fuel at the rate
of 15 B/Y. Started sand oil mix (1i#/gal) 20-0 Ottawa sand, .05#/fal Adomite, cne
millicuxéa radicactive sand per 1000# sand. Pumped in 2 batches 100 bbls sand oll mix
followed by 100 nylon balls. While pumping the third 100 bbls of sand oil mix the
first batch of balls seated and pressure rose to 3000 psi. Balls would pot bleed back.
Therefore, squeezed only 100 bbls sand oil mix out holes and cleared out remainder of
sand and balls. After backscut’oling 200 balls, only 9 showed svidence of having seated.



WELL NOoe Lb=ahB (#8kL) PROPERTY: Section 1LB RED WASH FIELD

July 17, 1958

Sand oil squeezed permeators down the tubing with Baker Model "C" retainer set at
5620%, Broke down formation with 20 bbls burner fuel at 3900 psi pumping at 7 BPFM,
Pumped in 50 bbls sand oil mix (13#/gal) 20<40 Ottawa sand, .05#/gal Adomite, 1
millicuries radioactive sand per 1000# sand, followed with 25 nylon balls and con~
tinued pumping with sand oil mix at 7 BFY at 4100 psi. After displacing balls with
3l bbls sand oil mix, balls seated and pressure rose to 5000 psi at zero rate.
Bled off and pumped an additional 25 bulls after the 2nd 50 bble of sand oilk mix.
Pressure again rose to 5000 psi at zero rate when balls seated. Bled back and
displaced tubing with 30 bbls of burner fuel. After backscuttling nylon balls 7
showed evidence of seating.

Gn G OGN G0 O Gn MDD GD WP W WS GF SO G GO WP WR 8 o> WP G0 W OB M0 W W W aP

July 18, 1958

Ran BcCullough Gamma Ray Log to locate zones of sand entry to formation. Results
inconclusive because of radioactive contamination of oil in hole.

Gn WD MO P 0 G XS WD Gp G @A WO OGP G O OGN G0 W W G D W A GF W WD A AF W MR R W W W M e &

July 19, 1958
Landed 2 1/2" tubing,

12.00 KoB., t0o tubing head
50  Boll Weevil Hanger
5594.56 181 jts tubing
1.10 KN
10,02 23" EUE

30,30 22" EUE perforated joint
Tubing landed

G ED Gb em OO WO GO S G @B Gn OO G B 0 GO G0 U AR P G S5 AP D AR YD 6D W W P GO 0 M SR W or W O W

Well placed on production August L, 1958, and produced for 26 days; averaging
151 B/D oil, 1 B/D water, and 195 MCF gas.

August 27, 1958
R&R Well Service moved on location.

On WP OGP e MR ap M WD WN OB EB a0 @ D G W & o GO MY WP AU GO W) WO WD BD Gn OB WGP P R G T W Ww O D M G0 a0 oD

McCullough gun perforated following intervals with 4 1/2% holes per foot: 5825-5819%,
5728‘_’5715“9 5662"56,49“0 .

Jet perforated following intervals with 6 super casing jets per foot:s 5835-5832,
58075803, 5787-5770, 5773~57U7, 5739-5729, 5685-5679, 5673-56631, Above measure-
ments are Schlumberger Electric Lo§° Collars checkad within 2¢ and correction
made from Gamma Log=Collar log to Schlumberger. ,
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WELL NO.s LL~1LB(8L) PROFERTY: Section 14B . RED WASH FIELD

Send oil squeezed with Halliburton equipment by Braden Head method. Used Hallibuwton
equipment and sand oil squeezed perforated intervals 5649-5662v, 566356731, 5679-5685¢,
5715=5728", 5729-571397, 5747-5773, 5779-5787!, 5803-5807*, 5819-5825¢, and 5832~5835¢.
down the casing with 480 bbls burner fuel - Rangely crude mix (30% Rangely crude) mixed
with 30,000# 20-k0 Ottawa sand. Used LOO neoprene - nylon balls in five 80 ball batches
after each 80 bbls of sand oil mix. Formation broke down at 1850 psi and took sand oil
mix at 31 BPH after balls started seating. Displaced sand oil mix with 225 bbls burner
fuel - Rangely crude mix (30% Rangely crude).

| August 30, 1958

Ran mill shoe, found 149 of £411, Cleaned out to effective depth 58627, GCirew-
lated out sand & balls, Lost 450 bbls of burner fuel to formation. Lo

September 2, 1958
Landed 2 1/2% tubing,

12.00 K. B. to mbing head
.50  Boll Weevil Hanger
5581.46 181 jts tubing
1.10 PSN ‘
10,02 10¢ tubing sub
0:30  Gas anchor
° Tubing landed

September 3; 1958
" Ran punp and rods. | | ~ a
ReR Woll Service rigged down and moved out.

f’ﬁxx.:cm '
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SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO DRILL____ — SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF WATER SHUT-OFF
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(ak) ‘
Well No. ___ bh-3l2 is located Sh7 ft. from__ {SNT line and 6&2 ft. from {%% line of sec. 3‘%‘

=5 ri fection 1k e R&3% L8
(i Sec. and Sec. No.) (Twp.) ange) (Meridian) -
Rod “ash matah " sh

(County or Subdivision) B (State or Territory)

(Field) ¥ 311.7’ ?‘}ﬁﬂ‘ i

DETAILS OF WORK

(State names of and expected depths to objective sands; show sizes, welghts and lengths of proposed casings; indicate mudding jobs, cement-
ing points, and all other important proposed work,

1. cendemater frse exicting perforaticns SCLI-H835Y with L2,00% gallone water
and h?,m senule

2, Noteh intervels 5635 5“5335' 5&6“}613§ ﬁ&ﬁ‘}@%’ Wiﬂ‘ﬁ%%, M"‘")g?g
S5hLmGSERYe  Aeldice and paniwster freo thess notches with 34,7200 sallone

water o ﬁ,xm sand.

3. Hotoh intervels 52L2eS239Y, SROMS206%, Acidize snd randesater Trac with
12,000 gellone and 12,590@ send,

he Clean out snd vreturn well o preductden,

I understand that this plan of work must receive approval in writing by the Geological Survey before operations may be commenced.

GALTy A S DL CLSRANYy s&TTIRN QVESIGH

fu Co Pox bES e
Address * //2 (£

Vernal, itah

) tivisien Superintendent
Y i&?f’r&;-fr{ﬁs};—fi{%ﬁ;&};l%}a&h}ri&mmnwh Lo 11N Pated

GPO 8632040



Ly 1 4570
* ® @ Bt o e e
(SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE) Land Ofice . 615 Lake GLYY
------ : UNITED STATES Ranse o 5‘&31
4, ; DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR  Unt———fod.iash
_____ gl GEOLOGICAL SURVEY
X

23
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO DRILL SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF WATER SHUT-OFF -
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO CHANGE PLANS SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING._. }:
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO TEST WATER SHUT-OFF_____ SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ALTERING CASING.
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO RE-DRILL OR REPAIR WELL SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF RE-DRILLING OR REPAIR_.
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO SHOOT OR ACIDIZE — SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ABANDONMENT
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO PULL OR ALTER CASING. SUPPLEMENTARY WELL HISTORY
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO ABANDON WELL

(INDICATE ABOVE BY CHECK MARK NATURE OF REPORT, NOTICE, OR OTHER DATA)

Yernal, Utah gar 18 19.61

(8) . -
Well No. bk liB 1s located b from__ {S } line and ___ 842 _ft. from %W} line of sec. &

S | Y 7e 23 LT
(34 Bec. and Sec. No.) (Twp.) (Range) (Meridian)
fed Wash = ¥intah Thah
(Field) (County or Subdivision) (State or Territory)

¥ully Dushing

The elevation of the¥erKelfces

DETAILS OF WORK

(State names of and expected depths to objective sands; show sizes, weights, and lengths of proposed casings; indicate mudding jobs, cement~
ing points, and all other important proposed worlS

Sandewater freced previonsly sxisting perforstions 5CLow56357%,

Cut 3' vertical oppoeed notohes 5613=5616t, Cut 2 verticsly opposed notches
0552555, G550-5552, 5506e5000, G606SE001, feidized and paodeswater froced
notches 555256141,

Cut vertical opposed notohes at 52065207, 5237-52L2 md 563554300, Condewatar
freced notohes S206e56381,

Production before work: L0 3/D oil, 5 /D weter, 677 4/D ges.
Production after work:s 230 /D oil, 2¢ 3/D woter, 993 /D zas,

1 understand that this plan of work must receive approval in writing by the Geological Survey before operations may be commenced.

LColifornia 041 Company, destern Divieion

Company ...

Address Ve e Hox LSY

Vernal, Utuh By Ko Lo GRINH

» ‘ / itle, HWvieion fuperintendent
YoNE, SISy UHOCTy TSy T, Ten e ii&ﬂkiml; T BTSN R PV S8 O N I B 1T

PO 862040 ¢




Y
ity 19a3) U D STATES SUBMIT IN TRI

DEPARTMERT OF THE INTERIOR verse ataey e
GEOLOGICAL SURVEY

TE* Form approved.
re- Budget Bureau No. 42-R1424.

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL XNO.

U-081

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservolr.
Use “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposals.)

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

b

OIL 7 GAS
WEY.L WELL OTHER

7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAMR

Red Wash

2. NAME OF OPERATOR

Chevron U.S.A. Inc.

8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.
P. 0. Box 599, Denver, CO 80201 84 (44-14B)
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
See also space 17 below.)
At surface Red Wash

547' FNL & 642" FEL (SE%SEL)

11. sgec., 1., B,, M., OR BLK, AND
SURVEY OR ARKA

Sec 14, T7S, R23E SLB&M

14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, ete.) 12. COUNTY OR PARISH| 13. STATE
KB 5787 Uintah Utah
16. Check Appropriate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF :

TEST WATER SEUT-OFF PULEL OR- ALTER CASING - WATER SHUT-OFF

FRACTURE TREAT ~ MULTIPLE COMPLETE . FRACTURE TREATMENT

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* . o SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)

BEPAIRING WBLL
~"ALTERING CASING
ABANDONMENT® _ .

NOTE : Report results of multiple ecompletion on Well
(Other) ) ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-

nent to this work.) *

It is proposed to clean out well to PBTD, perforate and acidize well as

follows:
1. MIR&RU. Hot oil annulus. NU BOPE. POOH w/tbg and sub—pump assembly.
- 2.° RIH w/bit, cdsing scraper-and tbg. ~Clean out to 5862. "Use 2%°KCl water, POOH.
3. --Perforate, -see—attached :
4 .=-RIH wi RBP, Packer-and. Tubing. -Straddlé-intervals.
5.7 "Acidize, see adttached
6. POOH w/RBP, Packer and Tubing. ~ ot
7. RIH w/tubing and sub-pump. \\ND\O
8. Place well on production. \/\(/,0 \&, _» 3-USGS
. %\( B \\f\\ \\) ~" 2-State
O\l%o f\$0 -Partners
BT RS P %—JCB
o 7 1-DLD
< 1-Sec 723
¥o sdditional . 1-File
disturbances req . -
for this aotivitie sis

18. I hereby certify that Ztoregoing {8 true and correct
SIGNED TITLE Englneerlng Assistant DATE Jan. 25 N 1979

g vy

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY i TITLE

DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*Gee Instructions on Reverse Side




FIELD: Red Wash

PROPOSED PERFORATING PROCEDURE

1. Changes intended: Open new zones to production.
2. Results anticipated: Increase production.

3. Conditions of well which warrant such work: Low production

4. To be ripped or shot: Shot
5. Depth, number and size of shots (or depth of rips): &—shots/ft.

5571~72
5565-68

6. Date last Log of well filed:
7. Anticipated additional surface disturbances: None
8. Estimated work date: Feb. 21, 1979
9. Present production and status:
Date BOPD MCFD BWPD

11/78 116 : 13 424



WELL NAME: RWU #84 (44-41B)

FIELD:

Red Wash

PROPOSED TREATMENT PROCEDURE

Objective: Increase production

Size and type of treatment: 5803-35 500 gal 7%% NE acid
5715-87 2500 gal 7%% NE acid
5596-5685 2300 gal .7%% NE acid
. 5552-72 400 gal 7%% NE acid
Intervals to be treated: 5206-42 300 gal 7% NE acid

Treatment dowa casing or tubing: Tlubing

.. Intervals to sﬁraddled with RBP and packer
; 11z1 s effects: >
Mé;%ﬁqa9§b£§g¥§tﬁ%en§fi§enzoiggécidtftakesfandfnapthalene?tofbefusediasidiverting-
agents. : ’ ' .

‘Disposal of treating fluid: Spent acid will be swébbed back

Name of company to do work: Dowell, Halliburton or Western

Anticipated additional surface disturbances: pgpe
Estimated work date: Feb. 22, 1979

5?£resent;status,;currenfzprbdutlibu;andzy:édueigg?tnteryai:‘

-
-

Date * BOPD _MCFD . " _BWPD

11/78 » 116 13 . 424

3



-

UNGED STATES

Form 9-331 '
SUBMIT IN TRI
(May 1963) (Other instructio’

TH*

Form approved,
Budget Bureau No, 42-R1424,

- re-
DEPARTME OF THE INTERIOR verse side) 0. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.
GEOLOGICAL SURVEY U - 081
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS I DT, ALLOTER O% hine
(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-—" for such proposals,)
1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
oIL GAS
WETLL WELL OTHEE Red Wash
2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME
Chevron U.S.A. Inc. . -
3. ADDRESS OF OPEBATOR 9. WELL NO.
P. 0. Box 599, Denver, Colorado 80201 84 (44-14B)
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.® 10. FIELD AND POOL, OB WILDCAT
iee alrsfo space 17 below.)
t, surface Red Wash
) 11. sEC., T., BR., M., OB BLE. AND
. SURVEY OR ABNA
547' FNL and 642' FEL (SESE)
Sec 14, T1S, R23E
14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 12, COUNTY OR PARISH| 13. STATE
KB_ 5787 Uintah Utah
16.

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO:.

TEST WATER SHUT-OFPF WATER SHUT-OFF

PULL OR ALTER CASING

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT

SHOOT OR ACIDIZB ABANDON®* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)

Check Appropriate Box To Indicate Nature of Nofice, Report, or Other Data

SUBSBQUENT REPORT OF :

BEPAIRING WELL
ALTERING CABING
ABANDONMENT*

(Other)

(NoTE : Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting an
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-

nent to this work.) *

Well was cleaned out, perforated, and acidized as follows:

MI and RU. ND wellhead.

RIH with bit and scraper.
Perforated. See attached.
RIH with RBP, packer and tubing.

NU BOPE. POOH with
CO to 5853.

NN PN
L]

tubing and BJ pump.

« Acidized. See attached. 3- USGS
. POOH with tools. Set CIBP at 5585. 2- State
7. RIH with BJ pump. 3~ Partners
8. Placed well on production. 1- JCB
1- Sec 723
1- File
Ko sdditional swrface
@isturbances required
for this activity.
18. I hereby certify, thyt the foregoing/As true and correct
SIGNED TITLE _Engineering Assis tant pate __July 18, 1979
(This spx‘ce for Federal or State office use)
APPROVED BY TITLE DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side




WELL NAME 84 (44-14B)

FIELD NAME Red Wash

COMPLETED TREATMENT PROCEDURE

1. Size and type of treatment: 5500 gal. 7-1/2% NE acid.

2. Intervals treated: 5206-5835
3. Treatment down casing or tubing. casing

4. Methods used to localize effects: Mixture of Benzoic acid flakes and
Napthalene

1

5. Disposal of treating fluid: Spent acid-will be swabbed back.

6. Depth to which wellﬂwas cleaned out: | 5853
7. Time spent,bai}ing an& cleaning out:

8. Date of work: February 20, 1979

9. Company who pefformed work:  yestern

10. 'Prodﬁction interval: - 5906-5835

11. Status and production before treatment:

_ Date . BOPD MCFD BWPD‘
/78 mé N . el

12.  Status and production after treatment:

Date BOPD - MCFD BWED
5/79 34 _ 21 ’ 549

JaM 6/8/76



WELL NAME: 84 (44-14B)

FIELD: Red Wash

COMPLETED PERFORATING PROCEDURE

—

. 1. Depth, number and size of shots (or depths of rips): 4 CJPF

5571-72
4 5565-68

2. C doi k: -
Pmpany oing wor 0il Well Perforators

3. Date of work: February 20, 1979

4. Additional surface distrubances: None

5. Production after work:

Date BOPD MCFD BWED

5/79 34 21 549

JaM 6/8/76
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Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(June 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR B"‘g:;ife:_’;‘;rg;gﬁgfs
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT — ‘
5. Lease Designation and Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U - 081
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir, 6. If Indinn, Allottee or Tribe Name
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposals
SUBMIT IN TR IPL ICATE 7. I Unit or CA, Agreement Designation
RED WASH
1. Type of Well
R wa [ v 1
8. Well Name and No.
Well Well Other
2. Name of Operator ‘ 84 (44- 1 48)
CHEVRON U.S.A. PRODUCTION CO. 9. API Well No.
3. Address and Telephone No. 43 - 047 - 1 5206
P .0 . BOX 599 3 DMER 3 CO . (303) 930'3691 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Arca
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) RED \MS'l - GRN .
11, BLMER Parih, state
547 FSL, 642 FEL, SEC. 14, T7S, R23E UINTAH, UTAH
12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D Notice of Intent D Abandonment 7 DChange of Plans
D Recompletion DNew Construction
m Subsequent Report D Plugging Back DNon-Routine Fracturing
D Casing Repair DWater Shut-Off
D Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing DConversion to Injection
m Other STATUS DDispose Water
(Note) Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

THIS WELL IS CURRENTLY SHUT IN WHILE UPGRADING WELL TEST FACILITIES. WE PLAN TO RE- EVALUATE
STATUS AFTER WILL TEST FACILITIES UPGRADES HAVE BEEN COMPLETED.

3 - BLM -
vEr . [REGEIVE]
1 - WELL FILE

1-JW APR 09 1992

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS & MINING

14. I hereby certify e foregoing ¥ ct
S, ‘JZX{/ 7)o oA 1ue PERMIT SPECIALIST e 3/26/92
TS space Tor Fedéral or State office se)

Approved by: Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.




Chevron U.S.A. Inc.
PO. Box 455, Vernal, UT 84078 » Phone (801) 789-2442

Chevron

=

FEBRUARY 15, 1993

ANNUAL REPORT OF
~_ SHUT-IN WELLS
‘lWONSITS VALLEY STATE/FEDERAL UNIT'

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
170 SOUTH 500 EAST
VERNAL, UT 84078

GENTLEMEN:
Enclosed, please find the annual report of shut-in wells in Red
Wash Unlt. If you have any questions, please call the above
address.

Sincerely,

by

J.T. CONLE |
AREA OPERATIONS SUPERVISOR

sdm
Enclosures

cc: state of Utah
Department of Natural Resources
Division of 0il, Gas and Mining
355 West North Temple ' -
3 Triad Center, Suite 350 :
Salt Lake City, UT 84180-1203

2

| _@Eﬂ
FEB 18 1993

DIVISION OF
OIL GAS & MINING




‘Gmmun ". "’

* gl ChevronUSA. Inc.
gl PO B0 55 Vel UTBA073 - Prone (601 765:242

FEBRUARY 15, 1993

ANNUAL REPORT OF
SHUT-IN WELLS
\ED_WASH -UNIT-

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
170 SOUTH 500 EAST
VERNAL, UT 84078

GENTLEMEN:
Enclosed, please find the annual report of shut-in wells in Red
Wash Unit. If you have any questions, please call the above
address.

Sincerely,

T Vi

AREA OP IONS SUPERVISOR

sdn
Enclosures

cc: State of Utah
Department of Natural Resources
Division of 0il, Gas and Mining
355 West North Temple ’ ‘ -
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
N Salt Lake City, UT 84180-1203

Buttram Energies, Inc.
6303 Waterford Boulevard, Suite 220

Oklahoma City, OK 73116 @EW@

FEB 18 1993

DIVISION OF
OIL GAS & MINING



Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES B“d:omu AP:ROVED s
- - et Bureau No. 1004-0
(June 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires: Morch 31,1993

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-081

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. — -
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposals 6 I fndan, Alloses or Tribe Name

7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE Red Wash Unit
1. Type of Well
oit Gas .
m Well D Well D Other =
8. Well Name and No.
2. Name of Operator RWU #84 (44'14B)
Chevron U.S.A. Inc. 9. API Well No.
3. Address and Telephone No. 43-047-15206
P.O. Box 455, Vernal, Utah 84078 (801) 789-2442 10, Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) Red Wash-Grn. River

11. County or Parish, State

547 FSL, 642 FEL, SEC. 14, T7S, R23E Uintah, Utah
12, . CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D Notice of Intent D Abandonment D Change of Plans
Recompletion D New Coustructicn
E-l Subsequent Report D Plugging Back D Non-Routine Fracturing
D Casing Repair D Water Shut-Off
D Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing D Conversion 1o Injection
m Other D Dispose Water
(Nete) Report ressits of multiple completion oa Well Compietion
or Recompistion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Propoeed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give perti dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give
subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Waell test facility upgrades were completed in 1992, We plan to re-evaluate this shut-in production well during 1993.

]R}E@I?

FEB 18 1993
DIvis) ;
OiL GAS g :‘MCI)\ITNG
" e T,
te ;Wb MOOU. (HS§ IS'ILH(\JLM __02010/03
(This space for Federal or State office use) v
— Title pee

Conditions of approval, if any:

FVLARB-6.BLM (JRL #2)



A

B -
Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES & ) @
(une 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTER §

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGF% ’

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS.ON:WI —
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a diﬁ"éré;i?ﬁéx;vﬁf :
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals

i FORM APPROVED

Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

Expires: March 31, 1993
. Lease Designation and Serial No.
U-081

ﬂﬁ. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

———— ——
e —— ——

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE

7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

i.  Type of Well

Oil Gas
@ O~ O

RED WASH UNIT

?. ‘Well Name and No.

RWU #84 (44-14B)

2. Name of Operator
CHEVRON U.S8.A. PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API Well No.

3. Address and Telephone No.
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH, VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 (801) 781-4302

43-047-15206

10. Field and Pootl, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T.. R., M., or Survey Description)

547’ FSL, 642’ FEL, SEC. 14, T7S/R23E

RED WASH-GRN. RIVER

11. County or Parish, State
UINTAH, UTAH

- CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
“ance of invent D Abandonment
D Recompletion
D Subsequent Report D Plugging Back
D Casing Repair
E] Znal Abandonment Sotice D Altering Casing
Other  Well Status

D Change of Plans
]
]
L]
]
D Dispose Water

(Note) Report results of muitiple compietion on Well
Completion or Recompietion Report and Log form.)

New Construction

Non-Routine Fracturing

Water Shut-Off

Conversion to Injection

13.  Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details. and grve pertinent dates. nicluding estimated date of starting any proposed work. 1f well is directionaily drilled,

give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones periinent to this work)

TA approval is requested for this well, which is believed to have gas recompletion potential. Gas potential will be tested sometime during the next five years.

A N

14, ihereby \ QONTRL |
Signed N h Tile  QOperations Assistant Date 08/30/94

' |
(This space for Federal or State office use) \Y
Approved by: Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any

oo — ——
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingiy and wilifully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fi or fraudulent or
representations as to any maiter within its jurisdiction.
e ———

*See instruction on Reverse Side



g

-

FORM APPROVED

Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES

(June 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE Budget Busesu No. 1004-0135
Expires: March 31, 1993

6. If Indian, Allottee o Tribe Name

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals ™" -

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE 7+ 1fUnit or CA, Agreement Designation
1. TypeofWell RED WASH UNIT
oil Gas
Well D Wel D Other T Well Name and No.
RWU #84 (44-14B)

2. Name of Operator

CHEVRON U.S.A. PRODUCTION COMPANY . APl Well No.
3. Address and Telephone No. 43-047-15206

11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH, VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 (801) 781-4302 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) RED WASH-GRN. RIVER

) 11. County or Parish, State
547° FSL, 642’ FEL, SEC. 14, T7S/R23E UINTAH, UTAH

= CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
Notice of Intent D Abandonment D Change of Plans
D Recompletion D New Construction
D Subsequent Report D " Plugging Back D Non-Routine Fracturing
D Casing Repair D Water Shut-Off
D Final Abandonment Notice D Altering Casing D Conversion to Injection
Other  Well Status D Dispose Water
(Note) Report results of multipie completion on Well
Compietion or Recompletion Report and l_;gg form.)

13 Describe Pr posed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details. and give pertinent dates, includi i d date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zomes pertinent to this work)

TA approval is requested for this well, which is believed to have gas recompletion potential. Gas potential will be tested sometime during the next five years.

( ) ~
14. | hereby cefnfy OMTRL —
Signed ol r\ Tide QOperations Assistant Date 08/30/94

— l I
— e ———

(This space for Federal or State office use) \Y

Approved by: Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person htowing..l-yandwillﬁxlly to make to any department or ag;;:Ly of the United States any false, fictitious or frsudulent statements or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction. v

- ————v—— ——
—— — p—

*See instruction on Reverse Side
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.Foun 3160-5 . UNITED STATES . FORM APPROVED

(June 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993
5. Lease Designation and Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-ost
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals ’ r If ndian, Allotiee or Tribe Name
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE 7. 1fUnit or CA, Agreement Designation
1. Type of Well . RED WASH UNIT
oil Gas .
Well D wel D Other - Wel Name and No,
RWU #84 (44-14B)
2.  Name of Operator
CHEVRON U.S.A. PRODUCTION COMPANY 0. API Well No.
3. Address and Telephone No. 43-047-15206
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH, VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 (801) 781-4302 10. Field and Pool, or Explorstory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec_, T, R, M., or Survey Description) RED WASH-GRN. RIVER
11. County or Parish, State
547’ FSL, 642’ FEL, SEC 14, T7IS/R23E UINTAH, UTAH
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
Notice of Intent D Abandonment D Change of Plans
Recompletion D New Construction
D Subsequent Report @ Plugging Back D Nos-Routine Fracturing
D Casing Repair D Water Shut-Off
D Final Abandonment Notice D Altering Casing D Conversion o Injection
D Other D Dispose Water
(Note) Report results of multiple compietion on Well
Completion o Recompletion Reportand Log form,)
13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pestinent details, and give pertinent dates, includi i d date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,

g:wsuhﬂnﬁcelomuomandmmndmdmnwmmldquﬁnﬂnmkemmdm pcmnau(ot}uswork)
We propose to complete the subject well as follows:

. MIRU. Release Arrowset I Packer. )

. Set CIBP at 5190 and cap with Ssx cement.

. TIH hele with packer and hydrotest tubing to 5000 PSI. Set packer at 4600’ and test.

. Perforate the following zones with 4 JSPF: 4562-4577° (F), 4557-4572° 4524-4534’ (F), 4519-4529, 5156-5163’ (Ic), 5135-5141° (Ib),
4948-4954° (Hc), 4826-4832’ (Gq), 47844788’ (Gm), 4680-4684’ (Gd), 5151-5158’, 5130-5136°, 4943-4949°, 4821-4827’ 4779-4783", 4675-4679".

. Swab/flow test well. S

. RDMO.

N

[

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

14, Ihereby certify that fg i true and comect.
T i ——

(This space for Federal or State office use)
Approved by: Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any

—_———  ——————————
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, mn-mfwnymwMWmequmﬁhmemmummc
representations as to any matter withan its jurisdiction.

— ——
——— ——

*See instruction on Reverse Side
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Form 3160-5 UNITED S"I ATES ' o FORM APPROVED
(une 1990 " DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ~ SEP 2 §1994 | oudsstpusmurio toosons
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT sl Expires: March 31, 1993
e ) G ol 3 hgase Designation and Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS - - w0 e : U-081
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or recntry to a different reservoir
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals - IFindian, Allotee or Tribe Name
SUBM’T IN IRIPLIC‘/‘ TE- 7. IfUnit or CA, Agreement Designation
1. Type of Wel RED WASH UNIT

oil Gas .
Well D Well D Other [X. Well Nawne and No.

RWU # 84 (44-14B)

2. Name of Operator

CHEVRON U.S.A. PRODUCTION COMPANY . API W=“L\‘<3_OH_ i 5&10
3. Address and Telephone No. 43-047-+5026>
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH, VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 (801) 781-4302 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
A, Location of Well (Foolage, Sec., T. R.. M., or Survey Description) RED WASIH-GRN. RIVER

11. County or Parish, State

547" FSL, 642° FEL, SEC. 14, T7S/R23E UINTAIL, UTAII
2 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Abandonment Change of Plans

D Notice of Intent

Subsequent Report

D Final Abandomment Notice

Recompletion New Construction

Plugging Back Nou-Routine Fracturing
Casing Repai Water Shut-Off
Alteting Casing

Conversion to injection

Other Dispose Water

LOOEEO
Uoodno

(Note) Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

I3 Describe Proposed or Comyeted Operations (Clearly state ol pertitient details, and give pertinent dales, including estimated date of starling any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface Jocations and easuted and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)

The following work was completed between 09/13/94 and 09/16/94: \/

. MIRU.

. Flow back well. Perforated tubing 4 JSPF at S170°. Tubing pressure at 330 PSI.

. Killed well with 10 ppg brine. Release Arrow packer.

. Set CIBP at 5190°. RIH with bit and scraper to 5190°.

. Pump 20 BBLS NGL down tubing. Tested casing to 500 PSI, good.

. Dump bail 2 sx. cement on top CIBP at 5190° TOC: S181°.

» RIH with 7" Lok-set packer. Ilydro-tested tubing in the hole to 5500 I'SI, no bad joints,

. Circulate annulus with packer fluids, set packer at 4495°. Tested casing to 500 PSI, good. Tested tubing and casing below packer to 750 PSI good.
Swab well.

. Perforated the following zones with 4 JSPF: 4562-4577° T, 5156-5163° I¢, 5135-5141° Th, 4948-4954° He, 4826-4832° Gq, 4784-4788° Gm, 4680-4684° G:d.
11. Release packer at 4495°, POOH with packer. -

12. RDMO.

—
SN G~ AN b N e

14, 'hereby certify that the foregouffhis true gd correct. g
Signed Tite  Team Leader Date / 09/19/94
- 7 J "

(Ihis space for Federal or Stute oftice use) / N ‘Hm
Approved by: Title

Date

Conditions of approval, if any

Title [R ULS., Section JOOL, mnkes it a cvime [or sny person Enowingdy asd willludly 1o mal+ 2 a0 depratinient or apency of e United States any falae, Getitions on Gaodulest atfeantcon
representotions as to any malter within its prisdiction

*See intruction on Reverse Side
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Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES .

. Qe {990) RTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals

FORM APPROVED
Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
Expires: March 3¢, 1993

3. Lease Designation and Serial No.

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE

7. 1f Unitor CA, Agreement Designation

1. Typeof Well

QOil Gas
D well L__l well EI Oter  MULTIPLE WELLS SEE ATTACHED LIST

RED WASH UNIT
I-SEC NO 761
8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator

CHEVRON U.S.A. INC.

. API Well No.

3. Address and Telephone No

11002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 (801) 781-4300

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Arca

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R., M., or Survey Description)

RED WASH - GREEN RIVER

11. County or Parish, State

UINTAH, UTAH

12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Abandonment

D Notice of Intent
Subsequent Report

D Final Abandonment Notice

Recompietion

Plugging Back

Casing Repair

Abhering Casing

Other  CHANGE OF OPERATOR

AL O

Change of Plans

New Construction

Non-Routine Fracturing

Water Shut-Off

Conversion to Injection

Dispose Water

HinInINIniN

(Note) Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Loy form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pentinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. 1f well is directionally drilled,

give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertineat to this work)

As of January 1, 2000 Chevron U.S.A. INC. resigns as Operator of the Red Wash Unit.
The Unit Number is I-'SEC NO 761 effective October 31, 1950.

The successor operator under the Unit Agreement will be
Shenandoah Energy Inc.

475 17th Street, Suite 1000

Denver, CO 80202

Agreed and accepted to this 29th day of December, 1999

RECEIVED
DEC 3 0 1999

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS & MINING

14.  1hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.

Signed A, E. Wacker d & (/L) G (/[C4 Title  Assistant Secretary Date 12/29/99
(This space for Federal or State office use)
Approved by: Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudul or

representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See instruction on Reverse Side
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining .

ROUTING ]

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1.GLH 4KAS |
2. CDWv~ s:gy Uy
3.JLT 6-FILE

Enter date after each listed item is completed

X Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent
Operator Name Change (Only) Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 01-01-2000

FROM: (0ld Operator):
CHEVRON USA INC

Address: 11002 E. 17500 S.

VERNAL, UT 84078-8526

Phone: 1-(435)-781-4300

Account No. NO0210

TO: ( New Operator):
SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC

Address: 11002 E. 17500 S.

VERNAL, UT 84078

Phone: 1-(435)-781-4300

Account N4235

CA No.

Unit: RED WASH

WELL(S)

NAME

API
NO.

ENTITY SEC.TWN LEASE WELL WELL
NO. RNG TYPE TYPE STATUS

RWU 95 (14-14A)

43-047-15214

5670 14-075-22E {FEDERAL [OW PA

RWU 82 (14-15A)

43-047-15204

99996 15-07S-22E |FEDERAL {OW PA

RWU 85 (34-21A)

43-047-15207

5670 21-07S-22E |[FEDERAL [OW PA

RWU 86 (23-21A)

43-047-15208

5670 21-075-22E |FEDERAL [OW PA

RWU 94 (12-22A)

43-047-15213

5670 22-07S-22E {FEDERAL [OW P

RWU 98 (21-22A)

43-047-15217

5670 22-075-22E |FEDERAL |[OW PA

RWU 83 (41-27A)

43-047-15205

5670 27-07S-22E [FEDERAL [OW P

RWU 96 (21-28A)

43-047-15215

5670 28-07S-22E |FEDERAL |OW PA

RWU 84 (44-14B)

43-047-15206

5670 14-075-23E {FEDERAL |[GW P

RWU 261

43-047-32739

5670 17-07S-23E [FEDERAL [OW TA

RWU 207

43-047-32738

5670 17-07S-23E [FEDERAL [OW P

RWU 90 (43-21B)

43-047-15211

5670 21-07S-23E |[FEDERAL |[OW p

RWU 99 (12-22B)

43-047-15218

5670 22-075-23E IFEDERAL [OW P

RWU 9 (43-23B)

43-047-15140

5670 23-07S-23E |FEDERAL [OW P

RWU 92 (11-23B)

43-047-15212

5670 23-07S-23E [FEDERAL [OW TA

RWU 87 (21-17C)

43-047-15209

5670 17-07S-24E |[FEDERAL |OW PA

RWU 210 (32-7F)

43-047-15310

5670 07-08S-24E |[FEDERAL |[OW PA

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 12-30-1999

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 08-09-2000




¥

3. The new company has been checked thr@ the Department of Commerce, Division of porations Database on: 08-23-2000 -

4. s the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 224885
5.. IfNO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: 02/04/2000

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator

for wells listed on: 02/04/2000
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ('""CA'): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Pro; The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,

for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 09/26/2000
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 09/26/2000
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: N/A
4. TFee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: N/A

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.:

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:

1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed has furnished a bond: N/A
2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on:

FILMING: .
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on: () 3 ’ch -2 (

FILING:
1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:

COMMENTS:




United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Utah State Office RECE] VED

P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155 FEB g7 '}Sﬁﬁ
[

DIVISION OF

IN REPLY REFER TO OIL, GAS AND MINING
UT-931
February 4, 2000

Shenandoah Energy Inc.
Attn: Rae Cusimano
475 17" Street, Suite 1000
Denver, Colorado 80202
Re: Red Wash Unit
Uintah County, Utah
Gentlemen:

On December 30, 1999, we received an indenture whereby Chevron U.S.A. Inc. resigned as Unit
Operator and Shenandoah Energy Inc. was designated as Successor Unit Operator for the Red
Wash Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effective February 4,
2000. In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the
designated party has obtained all required approval that would entitle it to conduct operations
under the Red Wash Unit Agreement.

Your statewide (Utah) oil and gas bond No. 0969 will be used to cover all operations within the
Red Wash Unit.

It is requested that you notify all interested parties of the change in unit operator. Copies of the
approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriate federal offices, with one copy
returned herewith.

Sincerely,

/s/ Robert A. Henricks

Robert A. Henricks
Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals
Enclosure

cc: Chevron U.S.A. Inc.

bce:  Field Manager - Vernal (w/enclosure)
“Division of Oil; Gas & Mining
Minerals Adjudication Group U-932
File - Red Wash Unit (w/enclosure)
MMS - Data Management Division
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron
UT931: TAThompson:tt:2/4/00



Page No. 6
02/0470C
Well Status Report
Utah State Office
Bureau of Land Management
Lease Api Number Well Name QTR Section Township Range Well Status Operator
uTuo558 4304716478 61 (12-27A) RED WASH SWNW 27 T 78 R22E WIW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
—HFYE80—— 4304 FI5185 62 (4 15€) RED-WASH-SWSH——— {5~ T-78~——R24E—ABD——— CHEVRONU—S—A~INCORPORATED—
uTuogt 4304715186 63 (21-22B) RED WASH NENW 22 T 78 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTu0546 4304715187 64 (32-27B) RED WASH SWNE 27 1 78 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
YOS5 P—————4304 715188 65— 431 5A - RED—RASHNESE——— 45T 78— R22E—P+A——CHEVRON—U—-S—A—INCORPORATED——
UTuo116 4304715189 66 (34-18B) RED WASH SESW 18 1778 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTU81 4304715190 67 (42-22B) RED WASH SENE 22 178 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTuo81 4304716485 68 (41-13B) RED WASH NENE 13178 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTu0566 4304715191 69 (21-27B) UNIT NENW R 27 778 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTU0566 4304716473 7 (41-27B) RED WASH NENE 27 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTU0559 4304715192 70 (23-22A) RED WASH NESW 22 T 7S R22E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu02148 4304715193 71 (21-18C) RED WASH NENW 1817s R24E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTu0566 4304715194 72 (23-27B) RED WASH NESW 27 1 7S R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTyo81 4304715196 74 12-13B RED WASH U SWNW 1317s R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu0566 4304715197 75 (21-26B) RED WASH NENW 26 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu02148 4304715198 76 (32-18C) RED WASH SWNE 181 7S R24E  POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTuo81 4304715199 77 (21-13B) RED WASH NENW 13T177s R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTU02030 4304715200 78 (32-28B) RED WASH SWNE 28 178 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTU0566 4304715201 79 (12-278) RED WASH SWNW 27 1 78 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu081 4304715139 8 (32-22B) RED WASH SWNE 22 178 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTU0933 4304715202 80 (14-27B) RED WASH SWSW 27 T 78 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu02025 4304715203 81 (41-31B) RED WASH NENE 31178 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
IS5 4304745 204 B2 A S A REDHASH SO 45T 78— R22E—PrA————CHEVRON-U—S—A—INCORPORATED———
UTu0558 4304715205 83 (41-27A) RED WASH NENE 27 T 78 R22E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTU081 4304715206 84 (44-14B) RED WASH SESE 14 T 78 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED

OS5 4304520785342 HA) - RED—WASH-SWSE 2+ T 78— R22E—ABD———————CHEVRON-U-S—A—INEORPORATED——
—HTIOTE0 4304715208 86252 tA Y REDWASHSWSE 21 T 78— R22E—ABD—————CHEVRON-U-S-A—INCORPORATER———
YR —4304745 209872137 C)REB—WASH-NENW —— 17— F—FS———R24E—ABD——————CHEVRON-U-S—A-INCORPORATER——

uTuo116 4304715210 88 (23-18B) RED WASH NESW 1871 7S R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu82 4304715140 9 (43-23B) RED WASH NESE 23 178 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTugs67 4304715211 90 (43-21B) RED WASH NESE 21 178 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu081 4304716479 91 (33-22B) RED WASH NWSE 2217s R23E  WIW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTy82 43046715212 92 (11-23B) RED WASH NWNW 23 T7s R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTU0566 4304716480 93 (43-278) RED WASH NESE 27 T 78 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu0559 4304715213 94 (12-22A) RED WASH SWNVW 227178 R22E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED

YOS ER 430475 2495 Hr A RED—WASH—SHSH T 78 ————R2RE—P+A—————CHEVRON-U-S—A—INCORPORATED ——
OS5 B -t 3OATS R 596~ B4R BAIRED—WASHNENH— 28T~ 75— RE2E—P+A——CHEVRON——S—A—TNEORPORATED——————

uTU02148 4304715216 97 (23-18C) RED WASH NESW 18T 7s R24E  WSWSI CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
HH0 9 5504 4 q 98 4 A RFDP—HIAR S i rall RZ2? X HEVYRON A CORPORERTED
uTu081 4304715218 99 (12-22B) UNIT SWNW 22 T 78 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTuo116 4304732739 RED WASH 261 NESW 171 7S R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu0116 4304732738 RWU 207 SWSW 1717s R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
utuo116 4304732980 RWU 268 NESE 17717s R23E  WIW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED

** [nspection Item: 892000761A
“HFHE828 4304745310240~ 32-7F ) REDHASHSWKE 7-T-8% RLEPFK CHEVRON-U"S A INCORPORATED




OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

Change of Operator (Well Sold)

ROUTING
1. GLH

2.CDW
3.FILE

Designation of Agent/Operator

X Operator Name Change Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 2/1/2003
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N4235-Shenandoah Energy Inc N2460-QEP Uinta Basin Inc
11002 E 17500 S 11002 E 17500 S
Vernal, UT 84078-8526 Vernal, UT 84078-8526
Phone: (435) 781-4341 Phone: (435) 781-4341
CA No. Unit: RED WASH
WELL(S)
NAME SECITWN |[RNG|API NO ENTITY |LEASE |{WELL (WELL  |‘onfid
NO TYPE |TYPE | STATUS
RWU 94 (12-22A) 22 1070S {220E (4304715213 5670|Federal |[OW p
RWU 83 (41-27A) 27 0708 [220E 4304715205 5670{Federal |OW P
RWU 84 (44-14B) 14 1070S |230E 4304715206 5670|Federal |GW P
RWU 90 (43-21B) 21 [070S [230E[4304715211 5670{Federal |OW p
RWU 99 (12-22B) 22 |070S {230E|[4304715218 5670(Federal [OW P
RWU 9 (43-23B) 23 |070S [230E{4304715140 5670|Federal |OW P
RWU 92 (11-23B) 23 |070S [230E[4304715212 5670{Federal |OW TA
RWU 81 (41-31B) 31 10708 |230E|{4304715203 5670|Federal |OW P
RED WASH UNIT 259 16 |070S [230E|4304732785 5670|State oW P
RED WASH UNIT 260 16 {070S |230E14304732786 5670|State ow P
RWU 51 (12-16B) 16 |070S {230E|4304715177 5670|State ow P
RWU ST 189 (41-16B) 16 {070S |230E 4304715292 5670{State oW P
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2003

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on:  6/2/2003

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/19/2003

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

Business Number: 5292864-0151

QEP UB 22 FORM B.xis




* '

6. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: 7/21/2003

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 7/21/2003

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC'") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,

for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: n/a
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 8/28/2003
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 8/28/2003
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: n/a
4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: n/a

STATE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965-003-032

FEDERAL WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024

INDIAN WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 799446

FEE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965-003-033

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
The Division sent response by letter on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS:

QEP UB 22 FORM B.xls



. .:estar Exploration and Production Company
ependence Plaza
= §
y ] 1050 17th Street, Suite 500

Denver, CO 80265
Tel 303 672 6900 + Fax 303 294 9632

Denver Division

May 28, 2003

Division of Oil, Gas, & Mining

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P. O. Box 145801

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Attention: John Baza/Jim Thompson

Gentlemen:

This will serve as notice that through the internal corporate changes described below,
activities formerly conducted in the name of either Shenandoah Operating Company, LL.C
(SOC) and/or Shenandoah Energy, Inc. (SEI) will hereafter be conducted in the name of
QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.: i) the Shenandoah entities were purchased in July, 2001 by Questar
Market Resources, Inc., which is a2 mid-level holding company for the non-utility businesses
of Questar Corperation, i) Shenandoah Operating Company, LLC has now been merged
into Shenandoah Energy, Inc. (SEI), i) Shenandoah Energy, Inc. has now been re-named
QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. pursuant to a State of Delaware Amended and Restated Certificate
of Incorporation, iv) the same employees will continue to be responsible for opetations of
the former SOC and SEI properties, both in the field and in the office. Accordingly, the
change involves only an internal corporate name change and no third party change of
operator is involved. Please alter your records to reflect the entity name change. Attached is
a spreadsheet listing all wells affected by this change.

Should you have any questions, please call me at 303 - 308-3056.

Yours truly,

rank Nielsen
Division Landman
Enclosure RECEY =D
JUN G 7 2003
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SEI (N4235) to QEP (N2460) RED WASH UNIT

well_name Sec |T R apl Entity. Lease Type  |type |(stat
RED WASH 22-21B 21 10708 {230E (4304733522 5670|Federal ow |TA
RED WASH 24-20B 20 |070S |230E 4304733523 5670|Federal oW (P
RED WASH 305 (41-4F) 04 |080S [240E |4304732538 5670|Federal GW [TA
RED WASH 306 23 |070S |240E [4304732629 5670|Federal GW |P
RED WASH 44-19B 19 |070S [230E [4304733524 5670|Federal ow (P
RED WASH 44-20B 20 |070S |230E (4304733525 5670|Federal oW [P
RWU 1 (41-26B) 26 |070S [230E (4304715135 5670|Federal OW [TA
RWU 10 (12-23B) 23 1070S {230E 4304715141 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 101 (34-21B) 21 |070S [230E |4304715220 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 103 (34-15B) 15 |070S [230E (4304715222 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 108 (32-21B) 21 |070S |[230E 4304715226 5670|Federal ow [P
RWU 109 (21-28B) 28 |070S |230E 4304715227 5670(Federal oW (P
RWU 110 (23-23A) 23 |070S [220E }4304715228 5670 Federal ow |P
RWU 111 (32-24A) 24 |070S [220E 4304715229 5670|Federal oW |[TA
RWU 112 (32-28A) 28 10708 |220E 14304715230 5670 {Federal ow P
RWU 115 (21-19B) 19 {070S [230E [4304715233 5670 |Federal oW (P
RWU 119 (43-29A) 29 0708 |220E (4304715236 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 120 (23-28B) 28 |070S |230E 14304715237 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 121 (13-13B) 13 |070S [230E [4304715238 5670 |Federal GW P
RWU 122 (24-14B) 14 1070S |230E (4304715239 5670 Federal ow |P
RWU 125 (34-19B) 19 {070S |230E [4304715242 5670|Federal OwW |TA
RWU 126 (41-29A) 29 {0708 |220E [4304715243 5670|Federal ow (P
RWU 127 (12-19B) 19 {0708 |[230E (4304715244 5670 |Federal OW |TA
RWU 129 (14-15B) 15 |070S |230E {4304715246 5670|Federal ow [P
RWU 13 (14-22B) 22 |070S |[230E 4304715143 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 133 (41-34B) 34 |070S |230E |4304715250 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 136 (43-19B) 19 1070S [230E (4304715252 5670|Federal OW |TA
RWU 137 (34-28B) 28 {0708 {230E |4304715253 5670 |Federal GW |TA
RWU 138 (41-30B) 30 [{070S 1230E 14304715254 5670|Federal ow (P
RWU 140 (24-22B) 22 |070S |230E (4304715255 5670|Federal ow [P
RWU 141 (11-27B) 27 1070S [230E |4304715256 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 143 (33-14B) 14 |070S |230E |4304715257 5670 |Federal ow |P
RWU 144 (21-18B) 18 {070S [230E |4304715258 5670 Federal oW |TA
RWU 145 (24-13B) 13 |070S {230E {4304715259 5670 Federal oW |TA
RWU 147 (22-22B) 22 |070S |[230E [4304715260 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 15 (32-17C) 17 [070S [240E (4304715145 5670|Federal ow (P
RWU 151 (42-14B) 14 (0708 [230E (4304715264 5670|Federal ow [P
RWU 153 (14-29B) 29 [070S [230E |4304715265 5670|Federal ow (P
RWU 158 (32-30B) 30 {070S [230E 14304715268 5670 Federal ow (P
RWU 160 (32-15B) 15 [070S (230E (4304715270 5670{Federal ow |P
RWU 162 (12-20B) 20 |070S |230E (4304715272 5670|Federal oW [TA
RWU 164 (12-28B) 28 |070S |230E (4304715274 5670|Federal oW |P
RWU 165 (32-26B) 26 {0708 [230E (4304715275 5670|Federal GW |TA
RWU 167 (23-21B) 21 j070S [230E (4304715277 5670|Federal ow |S
RWU 168 (23-24B) 24 1070S |230E |4304715278 5670|Federal OW |TA
RWU 172 (21-30B) 30 {070S 1230E (4304715280 5670|Federal OwW |ITA
RWU 176 (31-28B) 28 |070S {230E }4304715283 5670 {Federal oW |TA
RWU 177 (42-28B) 28 |070S |230E 14304715284 5670 {Federal oW |TA
RWU 178 (22-13B) 13 [070S [230E (4304715285 5670|Federal OwW |TA
RWU 180 (31-23B) 23 |070S |230E [4304715287 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 181 (34-30B) 30 1070S [230E |4304715288 5670|Federal ow (P
RWU 184 (23-26B) 26 }070S |230E [4304715290 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 188 (23-20B) 20 |070S |230E (4304715291 5670|Federal ow |TA
RWU 19 (34-26B) 26 1070S |230E 14304715148 5670|Federal GW |TA
RWU 192 (41-33A) 33 [070S |220E (4304715294 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 193 (43-24B) 24 [070S [230E |4304715295 5670 Federal GW |S
RWU 194 (12-14B) 14 1070S [230E {4304715296 5670 {Federal oW IS
RWU 196 (23-17C) 17 1070S |240E [4304715298 5670|Federal GW |S
RWU 201 (32-28C) 28 1070S |240E (4304715302 5670|Federal GW (P
RWU 204 (23-25A) 25 {070S |220E |4304715305 5670|Federal ow P
RWU 205 (23-21C) 21 10708 [240E [4304715306 5670|Federal GW |TA
RWU 207 17 [070S [230E [4304732738 5670 |Federal ow |P
RWU 21 (32-14B) 14 [070S [230E (4304715150 5670 |Federal ow |P
RWU 212 (41-8F) 08 |080S |240E [4304720014 5670|Federal GW |P
RWU 21-24A 24 |070S [220E (4304733592 5670(|Federal ow |P
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SEI (N4235) to QEP (N2460) RED WASH UNIT

well name Sec |T R api Entit)& Lease Type type |stat
RWU 21-25A 25 {070S |220E |4304733576 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 219 (44-21C) 21 1070S [240E |4304730149 5670|Federal GW |P
RWU 220 (22-23B) 23 10708 |[230E (4304730192 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 221 (13-27B) 27 |070S |230E [4304730199 5670{Federal oW |TA
RWU 22-13A 13 |070S {220E 4304733765 5670{Federal ow |S
RWU 22-19B 19 10708 |230E 4304733559 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 222 (31-27B) 27 10708 |230E [4304730200 5670|Federal GW |TA
RWU 22-20B 20 |070S 1230E |4304733491 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 22-25A 25 10708 1220E [4304733786 5670|Federal OwW |P
RWU 22-29B 29 10708 |230E [4304733766 5670|Federal oW |S
RWU 224 (44-22B) 22 |070S |230E 14304730202 5670|Federal GW |TA
RWU 225 (13-23B) 23 {0708 |230E [4304730212 5670|Federal GW |TA
RWU 226 (24-23B) 23  |070S |230E 14304730249 5670|Federal GW |S
RWU 227 (14-26B) 26 |070S |230E (4304730257 5670|Federal OW |(TA
RWU 228 (21-34B) 34 1070S |230E |4304730258 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 229 (43-26B) 26 {0708 |230E |4304730259 5670|Federal oW |[TA
RWU 230 (14-18C) 18 |070S |240E 4304730309 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 231 (21-35B) 35 [070S [230E (4304730310 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 232 (12-26B) 26 |070S |230E (4304730311 5670|Federal {OW |TA
RWU 23-24A 24 {070S |220E |4304733567 5670{Federal ow [P
RWU 233 (12-25B) 25 0708 [230E [4304730312 5670{Federal oW [TA
RWU 234 (32-24B) 24 ]070S |230E [4304730313 5670|Federal Oow [P
RWU 235 (34-180) 18 [070S |240E |4304730314 5670|Federal oW [P
RWU 236 (21-19C) 19 |070S |240E 14304730340 5670|Federal Gw |P
RWU 237 (14-25B) 25 10708 |230E 4304730341 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 238 (32-35B) 35 |070S |230E [4304730342 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 239 (41-35B) 35 |070S |230E (4304730343 5670|Federal OW |TA
RWU 24 (34-14B) 14 1070S |230E 4304715152 5670 Federal ow [P
RWU 240 (12-36B) 36 |070S |230E [4304730344 5670|Federal ow [P
RWU 241 (22-14B) 14 1070S |230E 4304730345 5670|Federal OwW |P
RWU 24-18B 18 [070S |230E {4304733554 5670|Federal Oow |P
RWU 24-19B 19 [070S |230E [4304733492 5670{Federal Oow_ |P
RWU 242 (42-13B) 13 [070S |230E [4304730346 5670|Federal Oow_ |P
RWU 243 (42-180) 18 |070S |240E 4304730347 5670 Federal oW |TA
RWU 244 (23-19C) 19 [070S {240E {4304730348 5670|Federal GW |P
RWU 246 (22-180) 18 [070S |240E 14304730387 5670|Federal ow [P
RWU 247 (22-17C) 17 |070S |240E [4304730388 5670|Federal GW |P
RWU 26 (23-22B) 22 {0708 |230E [4304715153 5670|Federal ow [TA
RWU 262 (22-26B) 26 |070S |230E [4304730517 5670|Federal GW_ ITA
RWU 265 (44-26B) 26 |070S |230E (4304730520 5670|Federal GW [P
RWU 267 (32-17B) 17 [070S ]230E [4304732981 5670|Federal ow _|P
RWU 27 (43-14B) 14 |070S |230E [4304715154 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 270 (22-35B) 35 1070S {230E [4304731082 5670|Federal OwW _|P
RWU 272 (44-23B) 23 |070S |230E (4304731054 5670{Federal GwW_|P
RWU 273 (42-27B) 27 1070S [230E 4304731051 5670(Federal oW |TA
RWU 276 (44-27B) 27 |070S |230E {4304731053 5670(Federal ow_ |TA
RWU 278 (11-26) 26 1070S |230E [4304731076 5670{Federal GW |TA
RWU 28 (43-22B) 22 1070S [230E [4304715155 5670|Federal oW |P
RWU 280 (11-35B) 35 1070S |230E (4304731079 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 282 (42-26B) 26 |070S |230E [4304731080 5670|Federal GW_ |TA
RWU 284 (33-23B) 23 |0708 |230E (4304731476 5670|Federal GW |TA
RWU 285 (11-24B) 24 10708 |230E (4304731477 5670|Federal ow P
RWU 286 (42-21B) 21 [070S [230E (4304731478 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 287 (44-13B) 13 |070S [230E [4304731512 5670|Federal ow |TA
RWU 288 (24-27) 27 {070S |230E {4304731513 . 5670|Federal ow TA
RWU 289 (13-24B) 24 |070S |230E (4304731517 5670{Federal ow [P
RWU 29 (32-23B) 23 {0708 |230E (4304715156 5670|Federal ow [P
RWU 292 (42-23B) 23 {0708 |230E [4304731576 5670|Federal GW_ {TA
RWU 293 (22-22A) 22 |0708 |220E [4304731581 5670|Federal OW |TA
RWU 294 (24-18C) 18 [070S |240E (4304731582 5670|Federal GW [P
RWU 295 (11-22B) 22 |070S |230E [4304731577 5670(Federal GW |TA
RWU 296 (12-35B) 35 10708 |230E (4304731578 5670(Federal Oow |P
RWU 297 (24-15B) ' 15 [070S [230E [4304731579 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 298 (22-27B) 27 |070S |230E [4304731679 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 299 (32-18B) 18 |070S |230E 4304733018 5670{Federal ow (P
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SEI (N4235) to QEP (N2460) RED WASH UNIT

well_name ‘ Sec ‘T R ‘api Entity! Lease Type  |type |stat
RWU 3 (34-23B) 23 j070S |230E [4304715136 5670{Federal Oow P
RWU 30 (23-13B) 13 |070S |230E [4304715157 5670{Federal GW |TA
RWU 301 (43-15B) 15 [070S |230E [4304731682 5670 |Federal GW S
RWU 302 (22-24B) 24 10708 [230E (4304731683 5670 |Federal GW |TA
RWU 303 (34-17B) 17 1070S |230E 14304731819 5670{Federal Oow [P
RWU 31 (34-22B) 22 10708 [230E [4304715158 5670|Federal oW [P
RWU 33 (14-14B) 14 10708 |230E (4304715160 5670{Federal GW |TA
RWU 35 (43-13B) 13 |070S |230E [4304715162 5670|Federal Oow |TA
RWU 36 (32-13B) 13 1070S |230E 14304715163 5670|Federal GW [P
RWU 38 (14-23B) 23 10708 [230E {4304715165 5670|Federal ow [P
RWU 39 (14-24A) 24 [070S |220E [4304715166 5670|Federal oW ITA
RWU 4 (41-22B) 22 {0708 |[230E [4304715137 5670{Federal OW |TA
RWU 40 (21-24B) 24  {070S |230E |4304715167 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 41 (34-13B) 13 {070S ]230E 4304715168 5670|Federal OW [P
RWU 41-24A 24 1070S (220E |4304733769 5670|Federal ow [P
RWU 41-25A 25 0708 [220E (4304733579 5670|Federal ow [P
RWU 42 (21-29C) 29 |070S [240E [4304715169 5670|Federal GW [P
RWU 42-19B 19 1070S [230E [4304733556 5670 |Federal ow (P
RWU 42-20B 20 {070S |230E [4304733490 5670{Federal ow |P
RWU 42-24A 24 10708 {220E 14304733569 5670|Federal ow [P
RWU 42-25A 25 {0708 |220E 14304733580 5670(Federal oW S
RWU 42-30B 30 |070S [230E (4304733771 5670|Federal oW [P
RWU 43 (12-17B) 17 1070S {230E 4304715170 5670|Federal oW [P
RWU 44 (32-33C) 33 |070S j240E 4304715171 5670{Federal GW [P
RWU 44-18B 18 [070S |230E [4304733594 5670{Federal ow P
RWU 44-30B 30 |070S [230E 4304733772 5670{Federal oW [P
RWU 45 (23-30B) 30 0708 [230E (4304715172 5670{Federal - [OW |TA
RWU 46 (41-21C) 21 [070S [240E 14304715173 5670|Federal GW |TA
RWU 49 (12-29B) 29 [070S |230E (4304715175 5670|Federal oW |[TA
RWU 5 (41-23B) 23 |070S [230E |4304715138 5670|Federal ow [P
RWU 50 (14-23A) 23 {070S |220E }4304715176 5670|Federal Oow P
RWU 52 (14-18B) 18 {070S |230E }4304715178 5670({Federal ow |TA
RWU 53 (41-25A) 25 [070S [220E 4304715179 5670|Federal ow {TA
RWU 57 (12-18C) 18 |070S |240E }4304715183 5670|Federal ow P
RWU 63 (21-22B) 22 {0708 |230E {4304715186 5670{Federal GW (TA
RWU 64 (32-27B) 27 |0708 |230E 14304715187 5670{Federal oW {TA
RWU 66 (34-18B) 18 1070S |230E |4304715189 5670]Federal ow_|P
RWU 67 (42-22B) 22 [070S |230E 4304715190 5670|Federal oW TA
RWU 69 (21-27B) 27 070S |230E |4304715191 5670|Federal oW TA
RWU 70 (23-22A) 22 ]070S |220E (4304715192 56701Federal Oow_|P
RWU 71 (21-18C) 18 {070S [240E 14304715193 5670{Federal - |OW |P
RWU 72 (23-27B) 27 {070S {230E 4304715194 5670{Federal OwW_ |TA
RWU 74 (12-13B) 13 {0708 |230E 4304715196 5670 Federal Gw (P
RWU 75 (21-26B) 26 [070S |230E 4304715197 5670|Federal OW ITA
RWU 76 (32-18C) 18 {070S |240E 4304715198 5670!{Federal GW IS
RWU 77 (21-13B) 13 1070S [230E [4304715199 5670{Federal Oow _|P
RWU 78 (32-28B) 28 10708 |230E (4304715200 5670{Federal oW P
RWU 79 (12-27B) 27 |070S |230E 14304715201 5670{Federal oW |TA
RWU 8 (32-22B) 22 {0708 [230E (4304715139 5670 Federal ow_|P
RWU 80 (14-27B) 27 |070S [230E |4304715202 5670|Federal oW |P
RWU 81 (41-31B) 31 |070S [230E 4304715203 5670|Federal Oow_|P
RWU 83 (41-27A) 27 |070S |220E [4304715205 5670|Federal oW (P
RWU 84 (44-14B) 14  [070S [230E 4304715206 5670{Federal GW [P
RWU 9 (43-23B) 23 |070S |230E [4304715140 5670{Federal oW [P
RWU 90 (43-21B) 21 |070S [230E |4304715211 5670(Federal oW [P
RWU 92 (11-23B) 23 ]070S [230E |4304715212 5670 {Federal oW |TA
RWU 94 (12-22A) 22 |070S [220E |4304715213 5670|Federal oW [P
RWU 99 (12-22B) 22 |070S [230E (4304715218 5670|Federal ow |P
RED WASH UNIT 259 16 |070S |230E 4304732785 5670|State ow |P
RED WASH UNIT 260 16 {0708 [230E 14304732786 5670{State ow_|P
RWU 51 (12-16B) 16 10708 |230E (4304715177 5670|State ow [P
RWU ST 189 (41-16B) 16 1070S [230E [4304715292 5670|State ow |P
RED WASH UNIT 261 17 |070S [230E [4304732739 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 100-A (43-21A) 21 |0708 [220E [4304715219 5670|Federal Wl A
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SEI (N4235) to QEP (N2460) RED WASH UNIT

Entity.

well name Sec [T R api Lease Type type [stat
RWU 102 (41-24A) 24 1070S [220E (4304715221 5670|Federal Wi A
RWU 11 27 |070S |230E (4304715142 5670|Federal Wl 1A
RWU 11-19B 19 [070S |230E [4304733552 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 11-20B 20 |070S |[230E |4304733553 5670{Federal Wl A
RWU 11-25A 25 |070S [220E (4304733574 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 11-29B 29 |070S [230E {4304733590 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 11-30B 30 1070S |230E |4304733785 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 12-24A 24 1070S |220E 4304733591 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 13-19B 19 [070S |230E (4304733497 5670{Federal Wl A
RWU 13-20B 20 |070S |230E 14304733498 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 13-25A 25 1070S ([220E 14304733575 5670|Federal Wil 1A
RWU 14 (14-13B) 13 {070S |230E (4304715144 5670 |Federal Wi |A
RWU 148 (13-22B) 22 10708 |230E 4304715261 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 150 (31-22B) 22 1070S |230E (4304715263 5670|Federal wI |1
RWU 156 (23-15B) 15 1070S |230E (4304715267 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 16 (43-28B) 28 [070S 1230E (4304716475 5670|Federal wi I
RWU 161 (14-20B) 20 [070S [230E (4304715271 5670|Federal Wl I
RWU 17 (41-20B) 20 [070S [230E (4304715146 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 170 (41-15B) 15 1070S }230E (4304716495 5670|Federal wI |1
RWU 173 (21-21B) 21 [070S [230E |4304716496 5670 {Federal Wl A
RWU 174 (21-20B) 20 [070S [230E [4304715281 5670|Federal Wi A
RWU 182 (14-21B) 21 |1070S |230E 4304716497 5670{Federal Wil A
RWU 183 (33-13B) 13 {070S |230E (4304715289 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 185 (41-1B) 14 {070S |230E {4304716498 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 199 (43-22A) 22 [070S [220E 14304715301 5670iFederal Wl |A
RWU 2 (14-24B) 24 1070S [230E 14304716472 5670]Federal Wl A
RWU 202 (21-34A) 34 1070S |220E (4304715303 5670|Federal wlI |l
RWU 213 (41-33B) 33 [070S [230E ]4304720060 5670|Federal WD A
RWU 215 (43-28A) 28 |070S {220E ]4304730058 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 216 (21-27A) 27 1070S {220E 14304730103 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 23 (21-23B) 23 {070S |230E (4304715151 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 23-18C (97) 18 |070S |[240E (4304715216 5670]Federal Wl |1
RWU 25 (23-23B) 23 [070S [230E (4304716476 5670{Federal Wl A
RWU 258 (34-22A) 22 |070S [220E (4304730458 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 263 (24-26B) 26 |070S {230E }4304730518 5670|Federal wl |
RWU 264 (31-35B) 35 1070S {230E (4304730519 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 266 (33-26B) 26 {070S [230E (4304730521 5670|Federal WL il
RWU 268 (43-17B) 17 1070S [230E (4304732980 5670 Federal Wi A
RWU 269 (13-26B) 26 |070S [230E [4304730522 5670|Federal wI {1
RWU 271 (42-35B) 35 [070S [230E [4304731081 5670|Federal Wl I
RWU 275 (31-26B) 26 |070S [230E 14304731077 5670|Federal Wl [A
RWU 279 (11-36B) 36 1070S |230E 4304731052 5670 |Federal Wl A
RWU 283 (43-18B) 18 [070S [230E 14304732982 5670]Federal Wl A
RWU 31-19B 19 |070S |[230E 14304733555 5670{Federal Wl |A
RWU 31-25A 25 J070S |{220E (4304733577 5670 Federal Wl |A
RwWU 31-30B 30 {070S [230E }4304733788 5670 Federal Wl A
RWU 33-19B 19 1070S [230E {4304733499 5670{Federal Wl |A
RWU 33-20B 20 1070S |230E 14304733500 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 33-25A 25 10708 [220E [4304733578 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 33-30B 30 [070S [230E (4304733790 5670{Federal Wl |A
RWU 34 (23-14B) 14 |070S |230E |4304715161 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 34-13A 13 10708 |220E |4304733593 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 34-24A 24 1070S |220E 4304733568 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 48 (32-19B) 19 1070S [230E [4304715174 5670|Federal wl |1
RWU 56 (41-28B) 28 |070S [230E {4304715182 5670|Federal Wi A
RWU 59 (12-24B) 24 1070S 1230E [4304716477 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 6 (41-21B) 21 |070S j230E 14304716482 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 61 (12-27A) 27 [070S [220E (4304716478 5670|Federal Wi |l
RWU 68 (41-13B) 13 |070S [230E (4304716485 5670|Federal wlI |l
RWU 7 (41-27B) 27 10708 |230E (4304716473 5670 |Federal wIl |l
RWU 88 (23-18B) 18 0708 |[230E (4304715210 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 91 (33-22B) 22 |070S [230E (4304716479 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 93 (43-27B) 27 |070S |230E [4304716480 5670|Federal wl |l
RWU 324 (23-16B) 16 |070S [230E (4304733084 5670]|State wl |l
4
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United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
uT-922

June 9, 2003

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
1050 17" Street, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265

Re: Red Wash Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

On May 30, 2003, we received an indenture dated February 1, 2003, whereby Shenandoah Energy,
Inc. changed it name and QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. was designated as Successor Unit Operator for the
Red Wash Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effective June 9, 2003.
In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the
designated party has obtained all required approval that would entitle it to conduct operations under
Red Wash Unit Agreement. :

Your nationwide (Eastern States) oil and gas bond No. B000024 will be used to cover all operatlons
within the Red Wash Unit. e

It is requested that you notify all interested parties of the name change of unit operator. Copies of
the approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriate federal offices, with one copy
returned herewith.

Sincerely,
/s/ Robert A. Henricks

Robert A. Henricks
Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure
bce:  Field Manager - Vernal (w/enclosure)
SITLA

Division of Qil, Gas & Mining
Minerals Adjudication Group
File — Red Wash Unit (w/enclosure)
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron

UT922: TAThompson:tt:6/9/03



JUL 07 2003
3104 (932.34)WF
Nationwide Bond ESB000024
NOTICE
QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. : Oil and Gas

1050 17 Street Suite 500 : lease
Denver, Colorado 80265 :

Name Change Recognized

Acceptable evidence has been filed in this office concerning the name change of Shenandoah
Energy Incorporated into QEP Uinta Basin, Incorporated. QEP Uinta Basin, Incorporated is the
surviving entity. This name change is recognized effective April 17, 2003.

Eastern States will notify the Minerals Management Service and all applicable Bureau of Land
Management offices of the change by a copy of this notice.

If you identify other leases in which the merging entity maintain an interest, please contact thlS
office and we will appropriately document those files with a copy of this notice.

If you have any questions, please contact Bill Forbes at 703-440-1536.

Y illecr 5 focbes

Wilbert B. Forbes

Land Law Examiner

Branch of Use Authorization

Division of Resources Planning,
Use and Protection

be: JFO,MMS, ES RF, 930 RF, 932.34 RF, E-932: wbf:07 /07/03:440-1536/ QEP Unita Basin
MFp



Division of Qil, Gas and Mining

ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1.DJJ
2. CDW
Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 1/1/2007
FROM: (0ld Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2460-QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. N5085-Questar E&P Company
1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265
Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900 Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900
CA No. Unit: RED WASH UNIT
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG|API NO ENTITY |LEASE TYPE|WELL |WELL
NO TYPE | STATUS
SEE ATTACHED LISTS [ | *
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 4/19/2007
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 4/16/2007
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on:

4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah:

5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on:
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on:

5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on:

1/31/20035

Business Number: 764611-0143

IN PLACE

n/a
n/a

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM

7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on:

4/23/2007 BIA

4/23/2007

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements (""CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on:

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC")

The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on:

DATA ENTRY:

1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007

4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007

5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007

6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: Wa

BOND VERIFICATION:

1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024

2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 799446

3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965003033

3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:

4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on:

n/a

COMMENTS: THIS IS A COMPANY NAME CHANGE.

SOME WELL NAMES HAVE BEEN CHANGED AS REQUESTED

Questar E&P FORM A.xls 4/30/2007 AND 5/15/2007




10f7 QEP Uinta Basin {(N2460) to QUESTAR E and P {N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT
Original Well Name SEC | TWP | RNG AP1 Entity Lease Well Type |Status
|

RWU 1 (41-26B) RW 41-26B 26 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715135 | 5670 Federal |OW |TA
RWU 3 (34-23B) RW 34-23B SWSE 23 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715136 | 5670 Federal |OW P
RWU 4 (41-22B) RW 41-22B NENE 22 | 0708 | 23CE | 4304715137 | 5670 Federal |OW TA
RWU 5 (41-23B) RW 41-23B 'NENE 23 | 0708 | 23C6E = 4304715138 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 8 (32-22B) RW 32-22B SWNE 22 | 070S | 230E | 4304715139 | 5670 Federal |OW P
RWU ¢ (43-23B) RW 43-23B 'NESE 23 | 070S | 230E = 4304715140 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 10 (12-23B}) RW 12-23B [SWNW | 23 | 070S | 230E | 4304715141 | 5670 Federal |OW |TA
RWU 11 RW 34-27B 'SWSE 27 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715142 | 99996 Federal |WI A
RWU 13 (14-22B} RW 14-22B SWSW 22 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715143 | 5670 Federal |OW TA
RW 14-13B RW 14-13B SWSW 13 | 070S | 230E | 4304715144 | 99996 Federal |WI A
RWU 15 (32-17C) RW 32-17C ISWNE | 17 | 0708 | 240E | 4304715145 | 5670 Federal |OW P
RWU 17 (41-20B) RW 41-20B NENE 20 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715146 @ 5670 |Federal |WTI A
RWU 19 (34-26B) RW 34-26B SWSE | 26 | 070S | 230E | 4304715148 | 5670 Federal |GW S
RWU 21 (32-14B) RW 32-14B |SWNE 14 | 070S | 230E | 4304715150 | 5670 Federal |OW _|P
RWU 23 (21-23B) RW 21-23B SENW 23 | 070S | 230E | 4304715151 | 99996 Federal |WI A
RWU 24 (34-14B) RW 34-14B SWSE 14 | 070S | 230E | 4304715152 | 5670 |Federal [OW S
RWU 26 (23-22B) RW 23-22B NESW 22 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715153 | 5670 |Federal OW TA |
RWU 27 (43-14B) RW 43-14B _|INESE 14 | 070S | 230E | 4304715154 | 5670 |Federal [OW TA
RWU 28 (43-22B) RW 43-22B INESE | 22 | 0708 ' 230E | 4304715155 | 5670 |Federal OW B i
RWU 29 (32-23B) RW 32-23B SWNE = 23 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715156 | 5670 |Federal OW P
RW 23-13B RW 23-13B NESW = 13 | 070S | 230E | 4304715157 | 5670 |Federal GW TA
RWU 31 {34-22B) RW 34-22B SWSE 22 | 070S | 230E | 4304715158 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 33 (14-14B) RW 14-14B SWSW 14 | 070S | 230E | 4304715160 | 5670 |Federal GW TA
RWU 34 (23-14B) RW 23-14B NESW 14 | 070S | 230E | 4304715161 | 99996 |Federal |WI A
RW 43-13B RW 43-13B NESE 13 | 070S | 230E | 4304715162 | 5670 |Federal |[OW TA
RWU 36 (32-13B) RW 32-13B ~ ISWNE | 13 | 070S | 230E | 4304715163 | 5670 |Federal |GW P
RWU 38 (14-23B) RW 14-23B SWSW 23 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715165 | 5670 |Federal |[OW P
RWU 39 (14-24A) RW 14-24A SWSwW 24 | 0708 | 220E | 4304715166 | 5670 |Federal |[OW TA
RWU 40 (21-24B) RW 21-24B NENW | 24 | 070S | 230E | 4304715167 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 41 (34-13B) RW 34-13B SWSE : 13 | 070S | 230E | 4304715168 | 5670 |Federal ow P
RWU 42 (21-29C) RW 21-29C NENW 29 | 0708 | 240E | 4304715169 | 5670 |Federal |GW P
RWU 43 (12-17B) RW 12-17B SWNW 17 | 070S | 230E | 4304715170 | 5670 Federal |OW P
RWU 44 (32-33C) RW 32-33C SWNE 33 | 070S | 240F | 4304715171 | 5670 Federal |GW P
RWU 45 (23-30B) RW 23-30B _ |INESW 30 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715172 | 5670 Federal |OW TA Ly
RWU 46 (41-21C) RW 41-21C INENE | 21 | 070S | 240E | 4304715173 | 5670 Federal |GW TA
RWU 48 (32-19B) RW 32-19B SWNE 19 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715174 | 99996 Federal |WI I
RWU 49 (12-29B) RW 12-29B SWNW | 29 | 070S | 230E | 4304715175 | 5670 |Federal |[OW TA
RWU 50 (14-23A) RW 14-23A SWSW 23 | 0708 | 220E | 4304715176 | 3670 |Federal OW P
RWU 52 (14-18B) RW 14-18B SWSW 18 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715178 | 53670 |Federal OW TA
RWU 53 (41-25A) RW 41-25A NENE 25 | 0708 | 220E | 4304715179 | 5670 |Federal OW TA
RWU 56 (41-28B) RW 41-28B NENE 28 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715182 | 99996 |Federal |WI |A




20f7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name 1Q/Q SEC | TWP | RNG API Entity |Lease  |Well Type |Status
RWU 57 (12-18C) |[RW 12-18C SWNW | 18 | 070S | 240E | 4304715183 @ 5670 |Federal OW P

RWU 63 (21-22B) [RW 21-22B NENW | 22 | 070S | 230E | 4304715186 | 35670 |Federal |GW TA
RWU 64 (32-27B) [RW 32-27B SWNE | 27 | 070S | 230E | 4304715187 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 66 (34-18B) 'RW 34-18B SWSE 18 | 070S | 230E | 4304715189 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 67 (42-22B) RW 42-22B SENE | 22 | 070S | 230E | 4304715190 | 5670 |Federal OW TA
RWU 69 (21-27B) RW 21-27B NENW | 27 | 070S | 230E | 4304715191 5670 |Federal OW TA
RWU 70 (23-22A) RW 23-22A INESW 22 | 070S | 220E | 4304715192 | 5670 |Federal OW P
RWU 71 (21-18C) RW 21-18C NENW | 18 | 070S | 240E | 4304715193 | 5670 |Federal OW p
RWU 72 (23-27B) RW 23-27B NESW 27 | 070S | 230E | 4304715194 | 5670 |Federal OW TA
RWU 74 (12-13B) RW 12-13B ISWNW | 13 | 070S | 230E | 4304715196 = 5670 |Federal |GW S
RWU 75 (21-26B) 'RW 21-26B NENW | 26 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715197 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 76 (32-18C) 'RW 32-18C SWNE 18 | 0708 | 240E | 4304715198 | 5670 |Federal |GW E___ "l
RWU 77 (21-13B) 'RWU 77 (21-13B) NENW | 13 | 070S  230E | 4304715199 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 78 (32-28B) 'RW 32-28B SWNE 28 | 070S | 230E | 4304715200 | 5670 |Federal |[OW P
RWU 79 (12-27B) [RW 12-27B SWNW | 27 | 070S | 230E | 4304715201 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 80 (14-27B) [RW 14-27B SWSW | 27 | 070S  230E | 4304715202 | 5670 |Federal |OW S
RWU 81 (41-31B) RW 41-31B NENE 31 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715203 | 5670 |Federal |OW P

RWU 83 (41-27A) [RW 41-27A NENE 27 | 070S | 220E | 4304715205 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 84 (44-14B) B RW 44-14B SESE 14 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715206 | 5670 |Federal |GW F
RWU 88 (23-18B) RW 23-18B INESW | 18 : 070S | 230E | 4304715210 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 90 (43-21B) RW 43-21B NESE 21 | 070S | 230E | 4304715211 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 92 (11-23B) [RW 11-23B NWNW | 23 | 070S | 230E | 4304715212 | 5670 Federal |OW TA.
RWU 94 (12-22A) RW 12-22A SWNW | 22 | 070S | 220E | 4304715213 | 5670 Federal |[OW P
RWU 23-18C (97) RW 23-18C NESW 18 | 070S | 240E | 4304715216 | 99996 Federal |WI e ]
RWU 99 (12-22B) RW 12-22B SWNW | 22 | 070S | 230E | 4304715218 | 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 100-A (43-21A) RW 43-21A NESE 21 | 0708 | 220E | 4304715219 | 5670 Federal 'WI A
RWU 101 (34-21B) RW 34-21B SWSE | 2i | 070S | 230E | 4304715220 | 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 102 (41-24A) RW 41-24A SENE 24 | 070S | 220E = 4304715221 | 5670 |Federal 'WI A
RWU 103 (34-15B) RW 34-15B SWSE 15 | 070S | 230E | 4304715222 | 5670 |Federal OW P
RWU 108 (32-21B) RW 32-21B |SWNE | 21 | 070S | 230E | 4304715226 @ 5670 Federal [OW [P
RWU 109 (21-28B) RW 21-28B NENW | 28 | 070S | 230E | 4304715227 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 110 (23-23A) RW 23-23A NESW | 23 | 070S | 220E | 4304715228 | 5670 |Federal |OW P 1
RWU 111 (32-24A) RW 32-24A SWNE | 24 | 070S | 220E | 4304715229 | 5670 |Federal |OW S
RWU 112 (32-28A) RW 32-28A SWNE | 28 | 070S | 220E | 4304715230 | 5670 |Federal |OW S
RWU 115 (21-19B) RW 21-19B NENW | 19 | 070S | 230E | 4304715233 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 119 (43-29A) RW 43-29A NESE 29 | 070S | 220E | 4304715236 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 120 (23-28B) RW 23-28B NESW | 28 | 070S | 230E | 4304715237 | 5670 |Federal |OW 'TA
RW 13-13B RW 13-13B NWSW | 13 | 070S | 230E | 4304715238 | 5670 |Federal |GW P
RWU 122 (24-14B) RW 24-14B SESW 14 | 070S = 230E | 4304715239 | 5670 Federal |OW P
RWU 125 (34-19B) RW 34-19B SWSE 19 | 070S | 230E | 4304715242 | 5670 Federal |OW TA
RWU 126 (41-29A) RW 41-29A NENE 29 : 070S | 220E | 4304715243 | 5670 Federal [OW P




3of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4130/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name = SEC | TWP | RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status
RWU 127 (12-19B) 5 19 | 070S | 230E | 4304715244 | 5670 ] Federal |[OW S
RWU 129 (14-15B) 'RW 14-15B SWSW 15 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715246 | 5670 Federal |OW P
RWU 133 (41-34B) RW 41-34B NENE 34 | 070S | 230E | 4304715250 | 5670 !Federa]_ oW P i
RWU 136 (43-19B) RW 43-19B NESE 19 | 0708 | 230F | 4304715252 | 5670 Federal |[OW TA
RWU 137 (34-28B) ~ |RW 34-28B |SWSE 28 | 070S | 230E | 4304715253 | 5670 Federal |GW TA
RWU 138 (41-30B) [RW 41-30B 'NENE 30 | 0705 | 230E | 4304715254 | 5670 |Federal OW P
RWU 140 (24-22B) [RW 24-22B [SESW 22 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715255 | 5670 Federal |OW P
RWU 141 (11-27B) RW 11-27B NWNW | 27 | 070S | 230E | 4304715256 | 5670 |Federal OW TA
RWU 143 (33-14B) RW 33-14B NWSE 14 | 0708 | 230E = 4304715257 | 5670 Federal |OW I
RWU 144 (21-18B) RW 21-18B NENW 18 | 070S | 230E | 4304715258 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RW 24-13B RW 24-13B SESW 13 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715259 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 147 (22-22B) RW 22-22B SENW 22 | 070S | 230E 4304715260 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 148 (13-22B) RW 13-22B NWSW | 22 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715261 | 99996 |Federal |WI (A |
RWU 150 (31-22B) RW 31-22B NWNE 22 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715263 | 99996 |Federal |WI |
RWU 151 (42-14B) RW 42-14B SENE | 14 | 070S | 230E | 4304715264 | 5670 |Federal |OW |P
RWU 153 (14-29B) RW 14-29B SWSW 29 | 070S | 230E | 4304715265 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 156 (23-15B) RW 23-15B NESW 15 | 070S | 230E | 4304715267 | 99990 [Federal |WI A
RWU 158 (32-30B) RW 32-30B SWNE 36 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715268 | 5670 Federal OW B B
RWU 160 (32-15B) RW 32-15B SWNE 15 | 070S | 230E | 4304715270 | 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 161 (14-20B) RW 14-20B SWSW 20 | 070S | 230E | 4304715271 | 99996 Federal |WI I
RWU 162 (12-20B) RW 12-20B SWNW | 20 | 070S | 230E | 4304715272 | 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 164 (12-28B) RW 12-28B SWNW | 28 | 070S | 230E | 4304715274 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 165 (32-26B) RW 32-26B SWNE 26 | 070S | 230E | 4304715275 | 5670 |Federal |GW TA
RWU 167 (23-21B) RW 23-21B NESW 21 | 0705 | 230E | 4304715277 @ 5670 |Federal |OW S _
RWU 168 (23-24B) RW 23-24B NESW 24 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715278 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 172 (21-30B) RW 21-30B NENW 30 | 070S | 230E | 4304715280 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 174 (21-20B) RW 21-20B NENW 20 | 070S | 230E | 4304715281 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 176 (31-28B) RW 31-28B 'NWNE 28 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715283 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 177 (42-28B) RW 42-28B [SENE 28 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715284 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RW 22-13B RW 22-13B SENW 13 | 070S | 230E | 4304715285 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 180 (31-23B) RW 31-23B NWNE 23 | 070S | 230E | 4304715287 | 5670 |Federal \OW TA
RWU 181 (34-30B) |IRW 34-30B SWSE 30 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715288 | 5670 Federal OW P
RW 33-13B |[RW 33-13B INWSE 13 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715289 | 5670 |Federal |WI Av"0
RWU 184 (23-26B) [RW 23-26B NESW 26 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715290 | 5670 §_Eederal_ GwW S
RWU 188 (23-20B) RW 23-20B NESW 20 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715291 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 192 (41-33A) RW 41-33A NENE 33 | 070S | 220E | 4304715294 | 5670 |Federal |OW R o
RWU 193 (43-24B) RW 43-24B NESE | 24 | 0705 | 230E | 4304715295 | 5670 |Federal |GW TA
RWU 194 (12-14B) RW 12-14B SWNW 14 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715296 | 5670 |Federal |OW [S
RWU 196 (23-17C) RW 23-17C NESW 17 | 0708 | 240E | 4304715298 | 5670 |Federal |GW TA
RWU 199 (43-22A) RW 43-22A _INESE 22 | 070S | 220E | 4304715301 | 99996 |Federal |WI A ]
RWU 201 (32-28C) RW 32-28C ISWNE 28 | 070S | 240F | 4304715302 | 5670 |Federal |GW P




40f7 QEP Uinta Basin {N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT
Original Well Name - [Q/Q | SEC | TWP | RNG API Entity [Lease  |Well Type |Status
¥ =
RWU 202 (21-34A) RW 21-34A NENW | 34 | 070S | 220E | 4304715303 | 99996 |Federal |WI I
RWU 204 (23-25A) RW 23-25A NESW 25 | 070S | 220E | 4304715305 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 205 (23-21C) RW 23-21C INESW | 21 | 070S | 240E | 4304715306 | 5670 |Federal |GW TA
RWU 2 (14-24B) RW 14-24B SWSW | 24 | 070S | 230E | 4304716472 | 99996 |Federal |WI A
RWU 7 (41-27B) RW 41-27B NENE 27 | 070S | 230E | 4304716473 | 99996 |Federal |WI I
RWU 16 (43-28B) RW 43-28B NESE 28 | 070S | 230E | 4304716475 | 99996 |Federal |WI I
RWU 25 (23-23B) RW 23-23B ~ |NESW 23 | 070S | 230F | 4304716476 | 99996 Federal |WI A
RWU 59 (12-24B) RW 12-24B SWNW | 24 | 070S | 230E | 4304716477 | 99996 |Federal |WI A
RWU 61 (12-27A) RW 12-27A SWNW | 27 | 070S | 220E | 4304716478 | 99996 |Federal |\WI I
RWU 91 (33-22B) RW 33-22B NWSE 22 | 070S | 230E | 4304716479 | 99996 Federal |WI A ]
RWU 93 (43-27B) - RW 43-27B NESE 27 | 0708 | 230E | 4304716480 | 99996 [Federal |WI I
RWU 6 (41-21B) RW 41-21B 'NENE 21 | 070S | 230E | 4304716482 | 99996 Federal |WI A
RWU 68 (41-13B) RW 41-13B |NENE 13 | 0708 | 230E | 4304716485 | 99996 [Federal |WI T 3
RWU 170 (41-15B) RW 41-15B NENE 15 | 0708 | 230E | 4304716495 | 99996 Federal |WI I
RWU 173 (21-21B) RW 21-21B NENW | 21 | 070S  230E | 4304716496 | 99996 Federal |WI _|A
RWU 182 (14-21B) RW 14-21B SWSW | 21 | 070S | 230E | 4304716497 | 99996 |Federal |WI A
RWU 185 (41-1B) RW 41-14B NENE | 14 | 070S  230E | 4304716498 | 99996 Federal |WI A
RWU 212 (41-8F) RW 41-8F NENE 08 | 080S | 240F | 4304720014 | 5670 |Federal |GW P
RWU 213 (41-33B) RW 41-33B NENE 33 | 070S | 230E | 4304720060 | 99996 |Federal |WD A
RWU 215 (43-28A) RW 43-28A NESE | 28 | 070S | 220E | 4304730058 | 99996 |Federal |WD A
RWU 216 (21-274) RW 21-27A NENW | 27 | 070S | 220E | 4304730103 | 99996 |Federal |WI A
RWU 219 (44-21C) RW 44-21C SESE 21 | 070S | 240F | 4304730149 | 5670 |Federal |[GW S
RWU 220 (22-23B) RW 22-23B SENW | 23 | 070S | 230E | 4304730192 | 5670 |Federal |[OW TA
RWU 221 (13-27B) RW 13-27B NWSW | 27 | 070S | 230E | 4304730199 | 5670 |Federal OW TA
RWU 222 (31-27B) RW 31-27B INWNE | 27 | 070S | 230E | 4304730200 | 5670 |Federal GW TA
RWU 224 (44-22B) RW 44-22B SESE 22 | 070S | 230E | 4304730202 | 5670 |Federal |GW ITa |
RWU 225 (13-23B) RW 13-23B INWSW | 23 | 070S | 230E | 4304730212 | 5670 |Federal .GW TA
RWU 226 (24-23B) RW 24-23B SESW 23 | 070S | 230E | 4304730249 | 5670 |Federal |GW S
RWU 227 (14-26B) RW 14-26B SWSW | 26 | 070S | 230E | 4304730257 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 228 (21-34B) RW 21-34B NENW | 34 | 070S | 230E | 4304730258 | 5670 Federal |OW P
RWU 229 (43-26B) RW 43-26B NESE | 26 | 070S | 230E | 4304730259 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 230 (14-18C) RW 14-18C SWSW | 18 | 070S | 240E | 4304730309 | 5670 |Federal |[OW P
RWU 231 (21-35B) |RW 21-35B NENW | 35 | 070S | 230E ' 4304730310 | 5670 Federal |OW TA
RWU 232 (12-26B) RW 12-26B SWNW | 26 | 0708 | 230E 4304730311 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 233 (12-25B) RW 12-25B SWNW | 25 | 070S | 230E | 4304730312 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 234 (32-24B) RW 32-24B |SWNE 24 | 0708 | 230E | 4304730313 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 235 (34-18C) RW 34-18C |SWSE 18 | 070S | 240FE | 4304730314 | 5670 |Federal |OW S
RWU 236 (21-19C) RW 21-19C NENW | 19 | 070S | 240E | 4304730340 | 5670 |Federal GW P
RWU 237 (14-25B) RW 14-25B SWSW | 25 | 070S | 230E | 4304730341 | 5670 |Federal OW P
RWU 238 (32-35B) RW 32-35B SWNE | 35 | 070S | 230E | 4304730342 | 5670 |Federal |OW ITA
RWU 239 (41-35B) RW 41-35B NENE 35 | 070S | 230E | 4304730343 | 5670 |Federal |OW ITA




50f 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460} to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4{30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT
Original Well Name - |QQ SEC | TWP | RNG API Entity |[Lease  |Well Type |Status
<) iy
RWU 240 (12-36B) RW 12-36B SWNW 36 | 0708 | 230E | 4304730344 | 5670 |Federal |OW S
RWU 241 {22-14B) RW 22-14B SENW 14 | 0708 | 230E | 4304730345 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RW 42-13B RW 42-13B SENE 13 | 0708 | 230E | 4304730346 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 243 {(42-18C) RW 42-18C SENE 18 | 0708 | 240E | 4304730347 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 244 (23-19C) RW 23-19C NESW 19 | 0708 | 240E | 4304730348 | 5670 |Federal |GW p
RWU 246 (22-18C) RW 22-18C SENW 18 | 0708 | 240E | 4304730387 | 5670 |Federal |OW p
RWU 247 (22-17C) RW 22-17C SENW 17 | 0705 | 240E | 4304730388 | 5670 Federal |GW P
RWU 258 (34-22A) RW 34-22A SWSE 22 | 070S | 220E | 4304730458 | 5670 Federal WI A
RWU 262 (22-26B) RW 22-26B SENW 26 | 0708 | 230E | 4304730517 | 5670 |Federal |GW TA
RWU 263 (24-26B) RW 24-26B SESW = 26 | 0708 | 230E | 4304730518 | 99996 Federal |WI I
RWU 264 (31-35B) RW 31-35B NWNE 35 | 0708 | 230E . 4304730519 | 99996 Federal |WI A
RWU 265 (44-26B) RW 44-26B SESE 26 | 0708 | 230E @ 4304730520 | 5670 |Federal GW P
RWU 266 (33-26B) RW 33-26B INWSE | 26 | 070S | 230E 4304730521 | 99996 |Federal WI I
RWU 269 (13-26B) |[RW 13-26B NWSW 26 | 0708 | 230E | 4304730522 | 99996 |Federal (WI A
RWU 273 (42-27B) RW 42-27B - SENE 27 | 0708 | 230E | 4304731051 | 5670 |Federal |OW |TA
RWU 279 (11-36B) RW 11-36B NWNW | 36 | 070S | 230E | 4304731052 | 99996 |Federal |WI A
RWU 276 (44-27B) RW 44-27B ) SESE 27 | 070S | 230E | 4304731053 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 272 (44-23B) RW 44-23B SESE | 23 ' 070S ' 230E | 4304731054 | 5670 |Federal |GW P
RWU 278 (11-26) |RW 11-26 NWNW | 26 | 470S | 230E | 4304731076 | 5670 |Federal |GW TA
RWU 275 (31-26B) RW 31-26B NWNE 26 | 0708 | 230E | 4304731677 | 99996 |Federal |WI A
RWU 280 (11-35B) 'RW 11-35B NWNW | 35 | 0708 | 230E | 4304731079 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 282 (42-26B) ‘RW 42-26B SENE 26 | 0708 | 230E | 4304731080 | 5670 Federal |GW TA
RWU 271 (42-35B) RW 42-35B SENE 35 | 070S | 230E | 4304731081 | 5670 Federal |WI |
RWU 270 (22-35B) RW 22-35B SENW 35 | 070S | 230E | 4304731082 | 5670 Federal |[OW P
RWU 284 (33-23B) RW 33-23B NWSE 23 | 0708 | 230E | 4304731476 | 5670 '_Fedcral GW TA
RWU 285 (11-24B) RW 11-24B NWNW | 24 | 0708 | 230E | 4304731477 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 286 (42-21B) RW 42-21B SENE 21 | 070S | 230E | 4304731478 | 5670 |Federal OW P
RW 44-13B RW 44-13B SESE 13 | 070S | 230E | 4304731512 | 5670 |Federal OW TA
RWU 288 (24-27) RW 24-27 SESW 27 | 070S | 230E | 4304731513 | 567G |Federal OW TA
RWU 289 (13-24B) RW 13-24B ~ NWSW | 24 | 070S | 230E | 4304731517 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 292 {42-23B) RW 42-23B :SENE 23 | 0708 | 230E | 4304731576 | 5670 |Federal |GW TA
RWU 295 {11-22B) RW 11-22B NWNW | 22 | 070S | 230E | 4304731577 | 5670 |Federal |GW TA
RWU 296 {(12-35B) RW 12-35B SWNW 35 | 070S | 230E | 4304731578 | 5670 |Federal |OW S
RWU 297 {(24-15B) RW 24-15B SESW 15 | 070S | 230E | 4304731579 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 293 (22-22A) RW 22-22A SENW | 22 | 070S | 220 | 4304731581 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 294 (24-18C) RW 24-18C B SESW 18 | 0708 | 240E | 4304731582 | 5670 Federal |GW P
RWU 298 (22-27B) RW 22-27B SENW 27 | 0708 | 230E | 4304731679 | 5670 Federal |OW TA
RWU 301 (43-15B) RW 43-15B NESE 15 | 0705 | 230E | 4304731682 | 5670 |Federal |GW TA
RWU 302 (22-24B) RW 22-24B SENW 24 | 0708 | 230E | 4304731683 @ 5670 |Federal |GW TA
RWU 303 (34-17B) RW 34-17B L —n SWSE 17 | 070S | 230E | 4304731819 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RED WASH 305 {(41-4F) RW 41-4F C-NE 04 | 080S | 240E = 4304732538 | 5670 |Federal |GW TA




6of7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT
Original Well Name - QQ SEC | TWP | RNG API Entity |Lease Well Type | Status
i |
RED WASH 306 RW 23-23C NESW 23 | 070S | 240E | 4304732629 | 5670 |Federal |GW P _
RWU 207 RW 14-17B |SWSW 17 | 0708 | 230E | 4304732738 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RED WASH UNIT 261 RW 23-17B NESW 17 | 0708 | 230E | 4304732739 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 268 (43-17B) RW 43-17B - NESE 17 | 0705 | 230E | 4304732980 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 267 (32-17B) RW 32-17B SWNE 17 | 0708 | 230E | 4304732981 | 5670 |Federal |[OW P
RWU 283 (43-18B) RW 43-18B NESE 18 | 0708 | 230E | 4304732982 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 299 (32-18B) RW 32-18B SWNE 18 | 070S | 230E | 4304733018 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 42-20B RW 42-20B SENE 20 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733490 | 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 22-20B RW 22-20B SENW 20 | 070S | 230E | 4304733491 | 5670 Federal OW S
RWU 24-19B RW 24-19B SESW 19 | 070S | 230E @ 4304733492 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 13-19B RW 13-19B NWSW | 19 | 070S | 230E = 4304733497 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 13-20B RW 13-20B NWSW = 20 | 070S | 230E | 4304733498 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 33-19B RW 33-19B NWSE 19 : 0708 | 230E | 4304733499 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 33-20B RW 33-20B - NWSE 20 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733500 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RED WASH 22-21B RW 22-21B SENW | 21 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733522 | 5670 |Federal |OW S
RED WASH 24-20B [RW 24-20B B |SESW 20 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733523 | 5670 |Federal |OW [P
RED WASH 44-19B RW 44-19B SESE | 19 | 070S | 230E | 4304733524 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RED WASH 44-20B RW 44-20B \SESE 20 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733525 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
[RWU 11-19B RW 11-19B NWNW | 19 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733552 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 11-20B RW 11-20B NWNW | 20 | 070S | 230E | 4304733553 | 5670 |Federal WI A
RWU 24-18B RW 24-18B SESW 18 | 070S | 230E | 4304733554 | 5670 Federal OW P l
RWU 31-19B RW 31-19B NWNE 16 | 070S | 230E | 4304733555 | 5670 |Federal |(WI A
RWU 42-19B RW 42-19B SENE 18 | 070S | 236E | 4304733556 . 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 22-19B RW 22-19B SENW 19 | 070S | 230E | 4304733559 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 23-24A RW 23-24A |NESW 24 | 070S | 220E = 4304733567 | 367C |Federal |OW P
RWU 34-24A RW 34-24A SWSE 24 | 070S | 220E | 4304733568 | 5670 |Federal |WI |A
RWU 42-24A RW 42-24A B SENE 24 | 070S | 220E | 4304733569 | 5670 |Federal |OW S
RWU 11-25A RW 11-25A NWNW | 25 ' 070S | 220F | 4304733574 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 13-25A RW 13-25A NWSW | 25 . 0708 | 220E | 4304733575 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 21-25A - RW 21-25A NENW | 25 | 070S ' 220E | 4304733576 5670 |Federal |OW P —]
RWU 31-25A RW 31-25A NWNE 25 | 070S | 220E | 4304733577 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 33-25A |RW 33-25A NWSE 25 | 070S | 220E | 4304733578 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RW 41-25AX RW 41-25A NENE 25 | 0708 | 220E | 4304733579 | 5670 |Federal OW P
RWU 42-25A RWU 42-25A 'SENE 25 | 0708 | 220E | 4304733580 | 5670 Federal |OW TA
RWU 11-29B RW 11-29B - NWNW | 29 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733590 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 12-24A RW 12-24A SWNW | 24 | 070S | 220E | 4304733591 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 21-24A RW 21-24A NENW | 24 | 0708 | 220E = 4304733592 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 34-13A RW 34-13A SWSE | 13 | 070S | 220E | 4304733593 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 44-18B RW 44-18B SESE 18 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733594 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RW 22-13A RW 22-13A SENW 13 | 070S | 220E | 4304733765 | 13296 |Federal [OW S
RWU 22-29B RW 22-29B SENW | 29 | 070S | 230E | 4304733766 | 5670 [Federal OW S




7Tof7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name - |QQ SEC | TWP | RNG API Entity |Lease Well Type |Status
RWU 41-24A RW 41-24A NENE 24 | 070S | 220E | 4304733769 | 5670 |Federal |OW |
RWU 42-30B RW 42-30B SENE | 30 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733771 | 5670 |Federal OwW P
RWU 44-30B RWU 44-30B SESE 30 | 070S | 230E | 4304733772 | 5670 |Federal |[OW P il
RWU 11-30B RW 11-30B NWNW = 30 | 070S | 230E | 4304733785 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 22-25A RW 22-25A SENW | 25 | 070S | 220E | 4304733786 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 31-30B RW 31-30B NWNE l 30 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733788 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 33-30B RW 33-30B NWSE | 30 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733790 | 5670 |Federal WL A
RED WASH U 34-27C RW 34-27C SWSE 27 | 070S | 240E | 4304735045 | 5670 |Federal GW |P
[RWU 34-22C RW 34-22C SWSE | 22 070S | 240E | 4304735098 | 5670 |Federal GW P
RW 12G-20C RW 12G-20C _ |SWNW 20 | 070S | 240E | 4304735239 | 14011 |Federal |GW S
RW 43G-08F RW 43G-08F NESE 08 | 080S | 240E | 4304735655 Federal |GW |APD
RW 22G-09F RW 22G-09F SENW 09 | 080S | 240E | 4304735656 | 15636 |Federal |GW 1OPS
RWU 34-23AG RW 34-23AG SWSE 23 | 0708 | 220E | 4304735668 @ 5670 Federal |OW P
RWU 34-27AG RWU 34-27AD SWSE 27 | 0708 | 220E | 4304735669 | 5670 |Federal |OW DRL
RWU 32-27AG RWU 32-27AG 'SWNE 27 | 0708 | 220F | 4304735670 5670 Federal |OW S
RW 14-34AMU RW 14-34 AMU SWSW 34 | 070S | 220FE | 4304735671 | 14277 |Federal |GW P
RW 12-08FG RW 12-08FG -TSWNW___US 080S | 240F | 4304736348 Federal |GW APD
RW 44-08FG RW 44-08FG SESE 08 | 080S | 240E | 4304736349 | 15261 |Federal |GW P
RW 12-17FG RW 12-17FG SWNW 17 | OBOS | 240E | 4304736350 Federal |GW APD
RW 34-34 AMU RW 34-34 AD SWSE | 34 | 070S | 220E | 4304736351 Federal |GW APD
RW 44-35 AMU RW 44-35 AMU SESE 35 | 0708 | 220E | 4304736352 | Federal |GW APD
RW 14-35 AMU RW 14-35 AMU SWSW 35 | 0708 | 220E | 4304736354 Federal |GW APD
RW 33-31 BMU RW 33-31 BD NWSE 31 | 070S | 230E | 4304736357 Federal |GW APD
RW 13-31 BMU RW 13-31 BD NWSW | 31 | 070S | 230E | 4304736358 Federal |GW APD
RW 32-15FG RW 32-15FG SWNE | 15 @ 080S | 240E | 4304736443 Federal |GW APD
RW 21-26AG RW 21-26AD NENW | 26 | 070S | 220E | 4304736768 Federal |OW APD
RW 43-26 AG RW 43-26AG NESE 26 | 070S 220E | 4304736769 Federal |OW APD
RW 43-23AG RW 43-23AG NESE 23 | 0708 | 220E | 4304736770 Federal |OW APD
RW 41-26AG [RW 41-26AG NENE 26 | 070S | 220E | 4304736318 [ Federal |[OW |APD
RW 04-25BG RW 04-25B NWSW 25 | 0708 | 230E | 4304736982 | Federal |OW APD
RW 01-25BG RW 01-25BG NWNW | 25 | 070S | 230E | 4304736983 Federal |[OW APD
RW 04-26BG RW 04-26BG SESW 26 | 0708 | 230E | 4304736984 Federal |OW APD
RW 01-26BG RW 01-26BG SWNW 26 | 070S @ 230E | 4304736985 Federal OW APD
RW 01-35BG RW 01-35BG SWNW 35 | 070S | 230E | 4304736986 Federal OW APD




1 0f 1 QEP Uinta Basin {N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT
Original Well Name o [oYe) SEC | TWP | RNG API Entity Lease  Well Type Status
i el - | |
RWU 51 {12-16B) RW 12-16B SWNW i6 | 0708 | 230E | 43064715177 | 5670 %State oW P
RWU ST 189 (41-16B) RW 41-16B NENE i6 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715292 | 5670 State OW S
RED WASH UNIT 259 RW 14-16B SWSW 16 | 070S | 230E | 4304732785 | 5670 State ow P
RED WASH UNIT 260 RW 34-16B SWSE 16 | 070S | 230E | 4304732786 | 5670 State oW P
RWU 324 (23-16B) RW 23-16B SESW 16 | 070S | 230E | 4304733084 | 5670 |State WI OPS
RWU 21W-36A RWU 21W-36A NENW 36 | 0705 | 220E = 4304733730 State GW [LA
RWU 21G-36A RWU 21G-36A NENW 36 | 0708 | 220E = 4304733731 |State oW LA
RWU 41-36A RWU 41-36A NENE 36 | 0708 | 220E | 4304733732 |State ow LA
RWU 43-16B RWU 43-16B NESE 16 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733733 State ow LA
RWU 21-16B RWU 21-16B NENW 16 | 070S  230E | 4304733734 State oW LA
RWU 11-36A RWU 11-36A NWNW | 36 | 0708  220E | 4304733736 State ow LA
RWU 13-36A RWU 13-36A NWSW = 36 | 070S  220E | 4304733737 State oW LA
RW 32G-16C RW 32G-16C SWNE 16 | 070S | 240E | 4304735238 | 5670 |State GW P
RW 14-36 AMU RW 14-36 AMU SWSW 36 | 0708 | 220E | 4304736721 State GW APD
RW 01-36BG RW 01-36BG NWNW | 36 | 070S | 230E | 4304736887 | 5670 |State  |OW S
RW 24-16BG RW 24-16BG SESW 16 | 0708 | 230E | 4304737746 | 5670 |State oW DRL
RW 12-32BG RW 12-32BG SWNW | 32 | 0708 | 230E | 4304737946 | 15841 |State IGW DRL




STATE OF UTAH
DEFPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

FORM 9

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
see attached

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRI-BE NAME:
see attached

Do not use this form for propasals to drifl new wells, significantly despen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TQ DRILL form for such proposals.

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
see attached

1. TYPE OF WELL
oL wer ] GASWELL [] OTHER

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

see attached

2. NAME OF OPERATOR-

QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY

8. API NUMBER.
attached

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR. PHONE NUMBER:
1050 17th Street Sulte 500 . . Denver srare €O ,,-80265 (303) 308-3068

10, FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDGAT:

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: attached

county: Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT O O O
(Submit in Duplicate) ] ALTeR cAsiNG [] rracture Rear [ siberrack To REPAR WELL
Approximate date work will start. ][] CASING REPAIR [T] NewconsTRuGTION [[] vemporARILY ABANDON
1/1/2007 [] cHange To PREVIOUS PLANS [] operaTOR cHANGE [[J TuemngrePaR
[T] cHance TuBING [[] PLuG AND ABANDON [] ventorFLaRe
[0 susseQUENT REFORT [] cHANGE WELL NAME [ Puesack [T] wartER DISPOSAL
(Submit Originat Form Only)
[] cHance wew sTaTus [[] erooucTioN (START/RESUME) [} water sHuT-oFF
Date of work completion:
[J commINGLE PRODUGING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE /] omer: Operator Name
] cowvert weLL Tvre [(] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Change

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED QR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective January 1, 2007 operator of record, QEP Uinta Basin, Inc., will hereafter be known as QUESTAR EXPLORATION
AND PRODUCTION COMPANY. This name change involves only an internal corporate name change and no third party
change of operator is involved. The same employees will continue to be responsible for operations of the properties described

on the attached list. All operations will continue to be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLM Reference No. ESB000024)

" Utah State Bond Number: 965003033 W
Fee Land Bond Number: 965003033
Current operator of record, QEP UINTA BASIN, INC
attached list.

hereby r

"signs as operator of the properties as described on the

—e—

Ja /‘3 Nagsd, Executive Vice Presid
Successor operator of record, QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND P

and obligations as operator of the properties as descrj

ent, QEP Uinta Basin, Inc,
RODUCTION COMPANY, hereby assumes all rights, duties

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) _Dfﬁ'% K. Stanberry 5 ) me oSupervisor, Regulatory Affairs

. o -
SIGNATURE //,éi_,f L )4-‘4-“—'%‘_‘“‘\ DATE 3/16/2007
7 — L?

{This space for Stato use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

RECFVED
APR 13 2007
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MiNityi-




STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
see attached

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new weils, significantly despen axisting wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged walls, or to
drill horizontal laterals Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
see attached

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
see attached

1 TYPE OF WELL

oL werr [ GASWELL ] OTHER

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
see attached

2. NAME OF OPERATOR.

QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY

. APINUMBER:
attached

PHONE NUMBER:

(303) 308-3068

Denver

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
1050 17th Street Sulte 500 crnre @O -, 80265

10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: attached

county: Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH
Ih CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[Z] NOTICE OF INTENT [[] acioize [] oeeen [} REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submitin Duplicate) [ atercasing [7] FracTuRE TREAT [[] sioetrack To REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start; [7] casing repair [C] newconstrucTiON [C] TeEmMPORARILY ABANDON
1/1/2007 [ cHance TO PREVIOUS PLANS [] operator cHanGE [ rtueine Repar
] cHance TUBING [] rLuc aND ABANDON [ ventorFiare
(] suBSEQUENT REPORT [] cHaneE weLL name [[] rweeack [[] waTer pisposaL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[C] cHaNGE wELL STATUS [] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [] water shuT-0F¢
Date of work compiation:
[[] coMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ RecLamaTION OF WELL SITE & orHer: Well Name Changes
[7 convert wew Tvee [] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

2. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent detalls including dates, depths, volumes, etc,
PER THE ATTACHED LIST OF WELLS, QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY REQUESTS THAT THE

INDIVIDUAL WELL NAMES BE UPDATED IN YOUR RECORDS.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Dé(K Staptierry

e Supervisor, Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATURE /////...../ ‘/_%

ﬁq,;,%_mmg 4/17/2007

< 2

I’...._o-"’
{This space for State use only)

(5/2000} (Sea Instructions on Reverse Side)

RECEIVED
APR 19 2007

UIV.OF OIL, GAS & MINING




United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.0. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
uT-922

April 23, 2007

Questar Exploration and Production Company
1050 17th Street, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265

Re: Red Wash Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

On April 12, 2007, we received an indenture dated April 6, 2007, whereby QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
resigned as Unit Operator and Questar Exploration and Production Company was designated as
Successor Unit Operator for the Red Wash Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effective April 23, 2007.
In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the
designated party has obtained all required approval that would entitle it to conduct operations under
the Red Wash Unit Agreement.

Your nationwide oil and gas bond No. ESB000024 will be used to cover all federal operations within
the Red Wash Unit.

It is requested that you notify all interested parties of the change in unit operator. Copies of the
approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriate federal offices, with one copy returned
herewith.

Sincerely,

/s/ Greg J. Noble

Greg J. Noble
Acting Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals
Enclosure
bce:  Field Manager - Vernal (w/enclosure)
SITLA

Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
File - Red Wash Unit (w/enclosure)

Agr. Sec. Chron e EIVED
Reading File ik
Central Files APR 3 0 2007

UT922: TAThompson:tt:4/23/07

DIV, GF O, CAS & MINING



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET  (for state use only)
Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/14/2010
FROM: (01d Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N5085-Questar Exploration and Production Company N3700-QEP Energy Company
1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 ' Deaver, CO 80265
Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048 Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048
CA No. Unit: RED WASH
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG|API NO ENTITY |LEASE TYPE|WELL |WELL
NO TYPE STATUS
SEE ATTACHED

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/28/2010

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/28/2010
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/24/2010
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Requested
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5¢c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 8/16/2010 BIA not yet
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 8/16/2010
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 6/29/2010
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Qil and Gas Database on: 6/30/2010
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: __6/30/2010
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965010693

3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965010695

3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:

4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS:

QEP Energy (Red Wash) FORM A xls 06/30/2010



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OiL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER
See attached

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, orto ~

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIiBE NAME:
See attached

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
See attached

1 TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

olL LL GAS LL H
we [ WelL [ orher See attached
2 NAME OF OPERATOR: — 9. API NUMBER;
Questar Exploration and Production Company /V j VA b’ 5 Attached
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR' PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1050 17th Street, Suite 500 ., Denver .2 CO ,,..80265 (303) 672-6900 See attached
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See attached county: Attached
QTR/QTR. SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH
11 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT = O O
(Submit in Duplicate) ] aurercasing [} rracture TrREAT [] SIDETRACK TG REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: | [T]  CASING REPAIR [C] newconsTrucTION (] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
6/14/2010 [} crance 7o PREVIOUS PLANS [} oreraTor cHanee [ Tueine rRerar
[] cHanGE TuBING [] PLUG AND ABANDON [] venTorFLare
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT D CHANGE WELL NAME [:] PLUG BACK D WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[] crance weLL status [[] PRODUCTION (STARTRESUME) [] water sHut-oFF
Date of work compietion:
[] commnGLe PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE ] omer: Operator Name
[1 converTwew Tvpe [ RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Change

2. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Cleary show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective June 14, 2010 Questar Exploration and Production Company changed its name to QEP Energy Company. This name
change involves only an internal corporate name change and no third party change of operator is invoived. The same
employees will continue to be responsible for operations of the properties described on the attached list. All operations will
continue to be covered by bond numbers:

Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLM Reference No. ESB000024) /V 3 70’0
Utah State Bond Number: 965663633 : ' ; -

Fee Land Bond Number: '965603633-> 9@5@/0 673
BIA Bond Number: 789446 G4 50/0(93

The attached document is an all inclusive list of the wells operated by Questar Exploration and Production Company. As of
June 14, 2010 QEP Energy Company assumes all rights, duties and obligations as operator of the properties as described on
the list

NAME (PLEASE PRV MIOrgan Anderson Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE _, OE@L \Aﬂd L )q:ﬂ\/-

_TITLE

6/23/2010

DATE

{This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
JUN 2 8 2010
DIV.OFOIL, GASRMINNG

APPROVED _f /302009
4 A
144 /
Division of Oil, Gas ané%l%{ﬁ
Earlene Russell, Engineering Technician

(5/2000)



Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)

RED WASH

effective June 14, 2010

well_name sec| twp | mg |api entity | mineral |type |stat C
lease
RW 34-23B 23 1 070S | 230E |4304715136 5670 | Federal |IOW |P
RW 41-23B 23 | 070S | 230E 14304715138 5670 | Federal |[OW |P
RW 32-22B 22 | 070S | 230E |4304715139 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 43-23B 23 | 070S | 230E 14304715140 5670 | Federal |JOW |P
RW 32-17C 17 1 0708 | 240E |4304715145 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 34-26B 26 10708 | 230E /4304715148 5670 | Federal | GW |TA
RW 32-14B 14 | 0708 | 230E |4304715150 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 34-14B 14 1 070S | 230E |4304715152 5670 | Federal OW |S
RW 23-22B 22 1070S | 230E 14304715153 5670 | Federal |OW |TA
RW 43-22B 22 1 070S | 230E |4304715155 5670 | Federal (OW |P
RW 32-23B 23 10708 | 230E (4304715156 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 23-13B 13 1 070S | 230E |4304715157 5670 | Federal | GW |TA
RW 34-22B 22 | 0708 | 230E 4304715158 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 32-13B 13 |1 070S | 230E (4304715163 5670 | Federal |\GW |P
RW 14-23B 23 1070S | 230FE /14304715165 5670 | Federal OW |S
RW 14-24A 24 | 070S | 220E |4304715166 17554 | Federal | OW |DRL
RW 21-24B 24 | 070S | 230E |4304715167 5670 | Federal | OW |TA
RW 34-13B 13 10708 | 230E |4304715168 5670 | Federal [OW |P
RW 21-29C 29 | 070S | 240E (4304715169 5670 | Federal |GW |P
RW 12-17B 17 |1 070S | 230E |4304715170 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 32-33C 33 | 070S | 240E |4304715171 5670 | Federal GW |P
RW 14-23A 23 10708 | 220F 14304715176 5670 | Federal OW |P
RW 12-18C 18 | 070S | 240E |4304715183 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 21-22B 22 1 070S | 230E |4304715186 5670 | Federal | GW |TA
RW 34-18B 18 | 0708 | 230E |4304715189 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 21-27B 27 10708 | 230E |4304715191 5670 | Federal | OW |TA
RW 23-22A 22 1 070S | 220FE |4304715192 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 21-18C 18 | 0708 | 240E |4304715193 5670 | Federal |OW [P
RW 12-13B 13 | 070S | 230E 14304715196 5670 | Federal GW |S
RW 32-18C 18 | 070S | 240E (4304715198 5670 | Federal |GW (P
RWU 77 (21-13B) 13 10708 | 230E |4304715199 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 32-28B 28 | 0708 | 230E (4304715200 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 12-27B 27 1070S | 230E 4304715201 5670 | Federal  OW |TA
RW 14-27B 27 | 0708 | 230E 4304715202 5670 | Federal | OW [P
RW 41-31B 31 | 070S | 230E 4304715203 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 41-27A 27 1070S | 220E /4304715205 5670 | Federal |OW |S
RW 44-14B 14 | 0708 | 230E 4304715206 5670 | Federal |GW |P
RW 43-21B 21 10708 | 230E 4304715211 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 12-22A 22 | 070S | 220E |4304715213 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 12-22B 22 | 0708 | 230E [4304715218 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 34-21B 21 | 0708 | 230E 4304715220 5670 | Federal (OW P
RW 34-15B 15 | 0708 | 230E |4304715222 5670 | Federal OW |P
RW 32-21B 2] | 070S| 230E 4304715226 5670 | Federal | OW P
RW 21-28B 28 | 070S | 230E 14304715227 5670 | Federal |IOW |P
Bonds: BLM = ESB000024
BIA = 956010693
State = 965010695 1 of 4




Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
RED WASH
effective June 14, 2010

well_name sec| twp | mg |api entity | mineral |type |[stat |C
lease
RW 23-23A 23 10708 | 220E 14304715228 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 32-24A 24 | 070S | 220E |4304715229 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 32-28A 28 | 0708 | 220E |4304715230 5670 | Federal  OW |S
RW 21-19B 19 10708 | 230E |4304715233 5670 | Federal |(OW |P
RW 43-29A 29 10708 | 220E 14304715236 5670 | Federal |IOW |S C
RW 23-28B 28 | 070S | 230E 14304715237 17525 | Federal |OW |P C
RW 13-13B 13 |070S | 230E |4304715238 5670 | Federal |GW |P
RW 24-14B 14 | 0708 | 230E |4304715239 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 41-29A 29 | 070S | 220FE 14304715243 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 14-15B 15 | 0708 | 230E |4304715246 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 41-34B 34 1 070S | 230E |4304715250 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 41-30B 30 1 070S | 230E 4304715254 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 24-22B 22 10708 | 230E (4304715255 5670 | Federal OW |P
RW 33-14B 14 |1 070S | 230E 4304715257 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 21-18B 18 | 0708 | 230E |4304715258 5670 | Federal |OW |TA
RW 22-22B 22 | 070S | 230E {4304715260 5670 | Federal |OW |TA |C
RW 42-14B 14 1 0708 | 230E {4304715264 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 14-29B 29 | 070S | 230E (4304715265 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 32-30B 30 | 070S | 230F |4304715268 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 32-15B 15 10708 | 230E 14304715270 5670 | Federal | OW (P
RW 12-20B 20 | 0708 | 230E 4304715272 5670 | Federal |[OW |S
RW 12-28B 28 | 070S | 230E /4304715274 5670 | Federal OW |P
RW 32-26B 26 | 0708 | 230E 4304715275 5670 | Federal |GW |TA
RW 31-28B 28 | 070S | 230E |4304715283 5670 | Federal |OW |TA
RW 34-30B 30 | 070S | 230E [4304715288 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 23-26B 26 | 0708 | 230E 4304715290 5670 | Federal |GW |S
RW 41-33A 33 | 070S | 220F |4304715294 5670 | Federal |OW P
RW 43-24B 24 | 070S | 230E 4304715295 5670 | Federal | GW |TA
RW 12-14B 14 | 0708 | 230E 4304715296 5670 | Federal |OW |S
RW 32-28C 28 1 070S | 240F /14304715302 5670 | Federal |GW |P
|[RW 23-25A 25 1 070S | 220E (4304715305 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 41-8F 08 | 080S | 240F [4304720014 5670 | Federal |GW |P
RW 44-21C 21 10708 | 240E |4304730149 5670 | Federal | GW |S
RW 13-27B 27 | 0708 | 230E 4304730199 5670 | Federal OW |TA
RW 21-34B 34 | 070S | 230E |4304730258 5670 | Federal  OW |P
RW 43-26B 26 | 0708 | 230F 14304730259 5670 | Federal |OW |TA
RW 14-18C 18 | 070S | 240E |4304730309 5670 | Federal |OW P
RW 12-26B 26 | 0708 | 230E 4304730311 5670 | Federal |OW |TA
RW 32-24B 24 10708 | 230E 4304730313 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 34-18C 18 | 070S | 240E |4304730314 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 21-19C 19 | 070S | 240F (4304730340 5670 | Federal | GW |P
RW 14-25B 25 | 070S | 230E 4304730341 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 32-35B 35 10708 | 230E |4304730342 5670 | Federal [OW |TA
RW 12-36B 36 1070S | 230E 14304730344 5670 | Federal |OW |S
Bonds: BLM = ESB000024
BIA = 956010693
State = 965010695 2 of 4




Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
RED WASH
effective June 14, 2010

well_name sec| twp | g |api entity | mineral |type (stat |C
lease

RW 22-14B 14 1 0708 | 230E [4304730345 5670 | Federal [OW |P
RW 42-13B 13 10708 | 230E |4304730346 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 23-19C 19 | 070S | 240E |4304730348 5670 | Federal |GW |P
RW 22-18C 18 0708 | 240E 14304730387 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 22-17C 17 | 070S | 240F |4304730388 5670 | Federal | GW |P
RW 44-26B 26 | 070S | 230E 14304730520 5670 | Federal |GW |P
RW 42-27B 27 1 070S | 230E |4304731051 5670 | Federal | OW |TA
RW 44-27B 27 | 0708 | 230E 14304731053 5670 | Federal OW |TA
RW 44-23B 23 10708 | 230E |4304731054 5670 | Federal |GW |P
RW 11-35B 3510708 | 230E |4304731079 5670 | Federal | OW [P
RW 22-35B 35 10708 | 230E 14304731082 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 33-23B 23 1 070S | 230F 14304731476 5670 | Federal |GW |TA
RW 11-24B 24 | 070S | 230F 4304731477 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 42-21B 21 | 070S | 230E 14304731478 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 13-24B 24 1 070S | 230E |4304731517 5670 | Federal |[OW |P
RW 42-23B 23 | 070S | 230E (4304731576 5670 | Federal (GW |TA
RW 12-35B 35 10708 | 230E |4304731578 5670 | Federal |OW |S
RW 24-15B 15 | 0708 | 230E |4304731579 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 24-18C 18 | 070S | 240E [4304731582 5670 | Federal |GW |P
RW 43-15B 15 10708 | 230E 14304731682 17643 | Federal |GW |DRL |C
RW 34-17B 17 1 070S | 230E |4304731819 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 41-4F 04 | 080S | 240F /14304732538 5670 | Federal |GW |TA
RW 23-23C 23 | 0708 | 240F 4304732629 5670 | Federal | GW P
RW 14-17B 17 | 070S | 230E |4304732738 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 32-17B 17 1 070S | 230E /4304732981 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 32-18B 18 | 070S | 230E 14304733018 5670 | Federal OW |P
RW 42-20B 20 | 0708 | 230E 4304733490 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 22-20B 20 1 0708 | 230E 4304733491 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 24-19B 19 | 070S | 230E |4304733492 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 22-21B 21 10708 | 230E 4304733522 5670 | Federal OW |S
RW 24-20B 20 1 070S | 230E |4304733523 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 44-19B 19 | 0708 | 230E |4304733524 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 44-20B 20 | 0708 | 230E 4304733525 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 24-18B 18 | 070S | 230E 14304733554 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 42-19B 19 | 0708 | 230E 14304733556 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 22-19B 19 | 070S | 230E 4304733559 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 23-24A 24 | 0708 | 220E 4304733567 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 42-24A 24 1 070S | 220E 14304733569 5670 | Federal |OW P
RW 21-25A 25 | 0708 | 220F 4304733576 5670 | Federal [OW |P
RW 41-25A 25 {0708 | 220E (4304733579 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 21-24A 24 10708 | 220E 14304733592 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 44-18B 18 | 070S | 230E |4304733594 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 41-24A 24 | 0708 | 220E (4304733769 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 42-30B 30 | 070S | 230E 4304733771 5670 | Federal |OW |S

Bonds: BLM = ESB000024
BIA = 956010693
State = 965010695

3 0of 4




Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
RED WASH
effective June 14, 2010

well_name sec| twp | mg |api entity | mineral |type [stat |C
lease
RWU 44-30B 30 | 0708 | 230E |4304733772 5670 | Federal |OW P
RW 22-25A 25 | 070S | 220E |4304733786 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 34-27C 27 | 0708 | 240E 4304735045 5670 | Federal |GW |P
RW 34-22C 22 | 070S | 240E /14304735098 5670 | Federal | GW |P
RW 34-23AG 23 | 070S | 220E |4304735668 5670 | Federal |OW |P
. |[RWU 32-27AG 27 10708 | 220E (4304735670 5670 | Federal OW |P
RW 14-34AMU 34 | 0708 | 220E 4304735671 14277 | Federal |GW |P
RW 44-08FG 08 | 080S | 240E 4304736349 15261 | Federal |GW |P
RW 34-34 AD 34 10708 | 220F /14304736351 16177 | Federal |GW |P
RW 33-31 BD 31 10708 | 230E (4304736357 Federal | GW |APD |C
RW 13-31 BD 31 10708 | 230E |4304736358 Federal |GW |APD |C
RW 21-26AD 26 | 070S | 220E [4304736768 5670 | Federal |(OW |OPS |C
RW 43-26AG 26 | 0708 | 220F 4304736769 16575 | Federal | OW |OPS |C
RW 43-23AG 23 [ 0708 | 220E |4304736770 5670 | Federal | OW |OPS |C
RW 41-26AG 26 | 070S | 220E 4304736818 5670 | Federal |[OW |OPS |C
RW 04-25B 25 1 070S | 230E |4304736982 17224 | Federal | OW |P
RW 34-27ADR 27 | 070S | 220F |4304739445 16330 | Federal | GW |P
RW 32-29CD 29 | 070S | 240FE |4304739854 Federal |GW |APD |C
RW 24-10FD 10 | 080S | 240E (4304739963 Federal | GW |APD |C
RW 34-20CD 20 | 070S | 240E |4304739964 Federal |GW [APD '|C
RW 32-20CD 20 | 070S | 240E 14304739965 Federal |GW |APD
RW 24-21CD 21 | 070S | 240E 4304739966 Federal | GW |APD |C
RW 41-28CD 28 | 0708 | 240E [4304739967 Federal | GW |APD |C
RW 41-33CD 33 | 070S | 240E 14304739968 Federal |GW |APD |C
RW 14-35 AMU 35 10708 | 220E 4304740051 Federal | GW |APD |C
RW 44-35 AMU 35 10708 | 220E |4304740052 Federal |GW |APD
RW 12-17FG 17 | 080S | 240E 14304740602 Federal |GW _APD |C
Bonds: BLM = ESB000024
BIA = 956010693
State = 965010695 4 of 4




United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
http://www.blm.gov/ut/st/en.html]

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3100
(UT-922)
JUL 2 8 2010
Memorandum
To: Vemal Field Office, Price Field Office, Moab Field Office
From: Chief, Branch of Minerals /@l& L 'g
Subjeét: Name Change Recognized

TAKE Prioe’
NAMERICA

Attached is a copy of the Certificate of Name Change issued by the Texas Secretary of State and
a decision letter recognizing the name change from the Eastern States Office. We have updated

our records to reflect the name change in the attached list of leases.

The name change from Questar Exploration and Production Company into QEP Energy

Company is effective June 8, 2010.

ce: MMS
UDOGM

)




Federal Approval of this

Action is Necessary
API Well No: 43047152060000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-081 '
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current -
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
DRILL form for such proposals. RED WASH
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well RW 44-14B
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047152060000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext RED WASH
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH
0547 FSL 0642 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: SESE Section: 14 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH
11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[ aciprze (] ALTER casING [] casING REPAIR
/ NOTICE OF INTENT D
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING D CHANGE WELL NAME
1/1/2011
[] cHANGE WELL STATUS [] cOMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [] coNvERT WELL TYPE
[l suBsEQUENT REPORT v' DEEPEN [J FRACTURE TREAT [J NEw consTRuCTION
Date of Work Completion:
[] OPERATOR CHANGE [] pLUG AND ABANDON [ pLuG BACK
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
[ spup REPORT
Date of Spud: [] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION [] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL [] TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
[] DRILLING REPORT [] wATER SHUTOFF [] sITA STATUS EXTENSION [] APD EXTENSION
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
QEP Energy Company requests approval to deepen the above well to a total
depth of 11,437' to the Mesaverde formation. In addition, the well pad has Approved by the
been modified to accomodate the larger drill rig and the surface use plan has Utah Division of
been revised to address all other changes. The ammended footages are: 548' 0Qil, Gas and Mining
FSL, 645' FEL Please refer to the following plans: Surface Use Plan 8-Point

Drilling Plan Plat Package Date: August 31, 2010
e Y |

By: \

TN

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Jan Nelson 435 781-4331 Permit Agent
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 8/30/2010

RECEIVED_August 30, 2010




QEP ENERGY COMPANY

RW 44-14B Drilling Prog
API: 43-047-15206
Summarized Re-Entry Procedure

1. Clear location of all unnecessary equipment.
% MIRU pulling unit.

3. ND tubing head, NU BOP’s (3M).

4. Kill well if necessary.

S8 POOH with rods, pump, and 2-7/8” tubing.
6. Completions will prep well for re-entry.

% POOH.

8. ND BOP’s

9. RD pulling unit, move off location.

10.  MIRU drilling rig.

11.  NUrig’s 5,000 WP rated BOP.

12. Drill out shoe and down to 11,437’ TVD.
13.  TOOH, and rig up logging truck.

14, Log well.

15. Circulate and condition hole, TOOH, LDDP.
16.  RU casing crew and run 4 2" casing.

17.  RU cement crew and cement casing.

18. ND BOP’s.

19. RDMO.

RECEIVED August 30, 2010




ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY
RW 44-14B

DRILLING PROGRAM

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore
Federal Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil & Gas No. 1, and
the approved plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of its
subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to
insure compliance.

1. Formation Tops

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth, TVD & MD
Green River 3,025°
Mohagany 3,733’
Original TD 5,920’
Wasatch 6,087’
Mesaverde 8,387’

Sego 10,747
Castlegate 11,387

TD 11,437

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil, Gas, Water, and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top an bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas,
or other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered as follows:

Substance Formation Depth, TVD & MD
Gas Wasatch 6,087’

Gas Mesaverde 8,387’

Gas Sego 10,747
Gas Castlegate 11,387°

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling
will be recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be
tested to determine commercial potential.
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ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY
RW 44-14B

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal,
Utah. Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If flows are
detected, samples will be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses
conducted. Fresh water will be obtained from Wonsits Valley water right A36125
(which was filed on May 7, 1964) or Red Wash water right # 49-2153 (which was
filed on March 25, 1960). It was determined by the Fish and Wildlife Service that
any water right number filed before 1989 is not depleting to the Upper Colorado
River System, to supply fresh water for drilling purposes. All water resulting
from drilling operations will be disposed of at Red Wash Central Battery Disposal
site; SWSE, Section 27, T7S, R23E or Wonsits Valley Disposal Site; SWNW,
Section 12, T8S, R21E.

3. Operator’s Specification for Pressure Control Equipment

A. 7 1/16” or 117 as available 5000 psi double ram with blind rams and pipe
rams, annular preventer and drilling spool or BOP with 2 side outlets.

B. All BOP connection subject to pressure shall be flanged, welded or clamped.

C. Kill line (2” min), 2 choke line valves (3" min), choke line (3” min), 2 kill line
valves (2” min) and a check valve, 2 chokes with one remotely controlled
from rig floor and a pressure gauge on choke manifold.

D. Upper and Lower Kelly cock valves with handles and safety valve and subs to
fit all drill string connections.

E. IBOP or float sub available.
F. Fill up line must be installed above the uppermost preventer.

G. Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved
stack working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 50 percent of internal
yield pressure of casing whichever is less. BOP and related equipment shall
meet the minimum requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 for
equipment and testing requirements, procedures, etc..., for a SM system and
individual components shall be operable as designed.
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ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY

RW 44-14B
4. Casing Design:
Hole Csg. Top | Bottom | Wt. Grade Thread | Cond. | Expected
Size Size (MD) | (MD) MW (ppg)
157 103/4” | sfc 302" | 40.5# J-55 STC | Existing N/A
8 3/4” 7" sfc 5,863 23# J-55 LTC | Existing N/A
61/8” | 412" sfc | 11,437 | 13.5# N-80 LTC New 8.8—-9.6
Casing Strengths: Collapse Burst Tensile (min)
103/4” | 40.5# J-55 STC | 2,090 psi | 3,580 psi 493,000 1b.
7" 23# J-55 LTC | 3,270 psi | 4,360 psi 313,000 Ib.
41/2" 13.5# N-80 LTC | 8,540 psi | 9,020 psi 270,000 1b.

Casing Design Factors

Burst: 1.4
Collapse: 1.3

Tension: 1.4

Maximum anticipated mud weight:
Anticipated Frac Pressure:

Cementing Program

4-1/2" Production Casing: sfc — 11.,437*

11 ppg (RW 34-34AD)
4,500 psi

Lead Slurry: 3,000 — 5,863. 130 sks (316 ft°) Halliburton Light Premium, 0.2%
WG-17 (Gelling Agent), 0.2% CFR-3 (Dispersant), 0.2% HR-5 (Retarder) Slurry
Weight 11.5 Ib/gal, 2.57 ft*/sk, 0% excess

Tail Slurry: 5,863’ — 11,437'. 390 sks (659 ft*) 50/50 Poz Premium Cement, 3
Ib/sk Silicalite (Light Weight Additive), 0.2% Super CBL (Expander), 0.3% HR-5
(Retarder), 0.5% Halad-344 (Fluid Loss Control), 20% SSA-1 (Fluid Loss
Control), 0.3% CFR-3 (Dispersant), Slurry Weight 13.5 1b/gal, 1.70 ft*/sk, 25%

excess over open hole portion

*Final cement volumes to be calculated from caliper log and will attempt to pump
cement to 3,000°.
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ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY
RW 44-14B

6. Auxiliary Equipment

A. Kelly Cock — yes

B Float at the bit — yes

C. Monitoring equipment on the mud system — PVT/Flow Show
D

Full opening safety valve on the rig floor — yes

E. Drilling below the 7” casing will be done with water based mud.
Maximum anticipated mud weight is 11 ppg.
F. No minimum quantity of weight material will be required to be kept on
location.
G. Gas detector will be used from intermediate casing depth to TD.
7. Testing, logging and coring program

A. Cores — Possible.
B. DST — none anticipated

C. Logging — Mud logging — Drill out to TD
GR-SP-Induction, Neutron Density.

D. Formation and Completion Interval:
— Stimulation will be designed for the particular area of interest as
encountered.
8. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential
Hazards

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. Maximum anticipated
bottom hole pressure equals approximately 6,305 psi. Maximum anticipated
bottom hole temperature is 210° F.

H2S has not been encountered in other wells drilled to similar depths in the
general area.
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ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1

QEP ENERGY COMPANY
RW 44-14B
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ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY
RW 44-14B
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RW 44-14B
API# 43-047-15206
SESE Sec 14 T7S R23E
Uintah County, Utah
KB
GL 5,776'
Original Spud 1994

Perfs:

45624577
4680'-4684'

4784' 4788
4826'-4832
4948'-4954'
5135-5141' <
5156'-5163'

7" 23# K-55 Set @ 5,863

41271358 N-80 4 A

LLIE I L e

Updated MPG 3-19-2010

10-3/4" 40.5# J-65
Set @ 552

PBTD @ 5,181'

A T0@590
61/8" OH

11,437' T
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QEP ENERGY COMPANY
RW 44-14B
548' FSL 645" FEL
SESE, SECTION 14, T7S, R23E
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
LEASE # UTU-081

ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1

MULTI - POINT SURFACE USE & OPERATIONS PLAN

An onsite inspection was conducted for the RW 44-14B on July 13, 2010. Weather conditions
were hot and sunny at the time of the onsite. In attendance at the inspection were the following individauls:

James Hereford Bureau of Land Management

Kevin Sadlier Bureau of Land Management

Holly Villa Bureau of Land Management

Jan Nelson QEP Energy Company

Stephanie Tomkinson QEP Energy Company

Guy Betts QEP Energy Company

Bob Haygood QEP Energy Company

Kelly Reyos QEP Energy Company

Dee Christensen QEP Field Service

McCoy Anderson Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying

1. Existing Roads:
The proposed well site is approximately 25 miles Northeast of Vernal, Utah.

Refer to Topo Maps A and B for location of access roads within a 2 — mile radius.
All existing roads will be maintained and kept in good repair during all phases of operation.
2. Planned Access Roads:

Please refer to QEP Energy Company Greater Deadmen Bench EIS UTU-080-200-0369V
Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

Refer to Topo Map B for the location of the proposed access road.

No new access road is proposed. The access to be used is the access to the existing RW 44-14B location.
Graveling or capping the roadbed will be preformed as necessary to provide a well constructed safe road.

3. Location of Existing Wells Within a 1 — Mile Radius:

Please refer to Topo Map C.

4. Location of Existing & Proposed Facilities:

Please refer to QEP Energy Company Greater Deadmen Bench EIS UTU-080-200-0369V
Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

Refer to Topo Map D for the location of the proposed pipeline.
All existing pipelines, powerlines and equipment will be moved off location before any construction begins.

Surface pipeline will be 6" or smaller. Pipeline will be welded together on location and dragged into place.

It was determined on the onsite by the BLM VFO AO that the facilities will be painted Covert Green.
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10.

Location and Type of Water Supply:

Please refer to QEP Energy Company Greater Deadmen Bench EIS UTU-080-200-0369V
Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

Water for drilling purposes would be obtained from Wonsits Valley Water Right # A 36125 (which
was filed on May 7, 1964) or Red Wash Water Right # 49-2153 (which was filed on March 25, 1960).
It was determined by the Fish and Wildlife Service that any water right number filed before 1989 is
not depleting to the Upper Colorado River System.

Source of Construction Materials:

Please refer to QEP Energy Company Greater Deadmen Bench EIS UTU-080-200-0369V
Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

Methods of Handling Waste Materials:

Please refer to QEP Energy Company Greater Deadmen Bench EIS UTU-080-200-0369V
Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

Ancillary Facilities:

Please refer to QEP Energy Company Greater Deadmen Bench EIS UTU-080-200-0369V
Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

Well Site Layout: (See Location Layout Diagram)

The attached Location Layout Diagram describes drill pad cross-sections, cuts and fills

and locations of the mud tanks, reserve pit, flare pit, pipe racks, trailer parking, spoil dirt
stockpile(s), and surface material stockpile(s).

Please see the attached diagram to describe rig orientation, parking areas, and access roads.

A pit liner is required. A felt pit liner will be required if bedrock is encountered.

Plans for Reclamation of the Surface:

Please refer to QEP Energy Company Uinta Basin Division Reclamation Plan

Site Specific Procedures:

Site Specific Reclamation Summary:

Reclamation will follow Questar Exploration and Production Company, Uinta Basin Division's Reclamation Plan,
September 2009 (Questar's Reclamation Plan) and the BLM Green River District Reclamation Guidelines.

All trash and debris will be removed from the disturbed area.

The disturbed area will be backfilled with subsoil.

Topsoil will be spread to an even, appropriate depth and disced if needed.

Water courses and drainages will be restored.

Erosion control devices will be installed where needed.

Seeding will be done in the fall, prior to ground freeze up.

Seed mix will be submitted to a BLM AO for approval prior to seeding.

Monitoring and reporting will be conducted as stated in Questar's Reclamation Plan. A reference site has been
establised and is included in this application.

It was determined and agreed upon that there is 6" inches of top soil.
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12

Surface Ownership:
Bureau of Land Management
170 South 500 East

Vernal, Utah 84078

(435) 781-4400

Other Information

A Class Ill archaeological survey was conducted by Montgomery Archaeology Consultants.

A copy of this report was submitted on April 27, 2010, Moac Report No. 10-027 and 10-027b by
Montgomery Archaeology Consultants. Cultural resource clearance was recommended

for this location.

A Class lll paleontological survey was conducted by Intermountain Paleo Consulting. A copy of
this report was submitted on May 5, 2010 IPC # 10-17 and 10-66 by Stephen D. Sandau.

The inspection resulted in the location of no fossil resources. However, if vertebrate fossil(s) are found
during construction a paleontologist should be immediately notified. QEP will provide paleo monitor if needed.
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QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
RW #44-14B

LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
SECTION 14, T7S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

Y
5 A

PHOTO: VIEW O

F EXISTING ACCESS
= —— |

l _1'—‘ Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying

e 85 South 200 East Vermal, Utah 84078
- Since 1964 - (435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
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LATITUDE = 40M1213.74" (40.203817)
PROPOSED WELL HEAD. LONGITUDE = 10917'11.44" (109.286511)
SECTION CORNERS LOCATED.

QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

Well location, RW #44—14B, located as shown in

the SE 1/4 SE 1/4 of Section 14, T7S, R23E,
S.L.B.&M., Uintah County, Utah.

BASIS OF ELEVATION

BENCH MARK 20EAM LOCATED IN THE SE 1/4 OF SECTION
35, T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M., TAKEN FROM THE OURAY SE,
QUADRANGLE, UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTE QUAD
(TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL SURVEY. SAID
ELEVATION IS MARKED AS BEING 4697 FEET,

BASIS OF BEARINGS

1936 Brass Cgp

BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.
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QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD. /[
LOCATION LAYOUT FOR

[ FICURE #7]
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0
s
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£ (Bim. Pit) N\ N ¥ Round Corner |~ ‘
[M . \7° Heeaed \ 2 Existing
N 7 \ K { -C—-2.8 Access
Nole: \\\\\ \ T £ 781"
Keyway lo be Cul Prio > \ F—8 0’ I
to Dike Construction, L - 57. PR L Q! r?n l 555,
\ £l 673 (‘4 55" ‘*’W Sta. 0+00
b NS
Power —— e =D 2 c—-2. 7J
Role " ) AN P £l 780"
Elev. Ungraded Ground Al Loc. Stake = 577\5.5: UINTAH ENCINEERINC & LAND SURVEYINC
FINISHED GRADE ELEV. AT LOC. STAKE = 5775.3 85 So. 200 Fast * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (435) 789~1017
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9 QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD. /F[GURE #2[
i | X—Section TYPICAL CROSS SECTION FOR ! L
o || Scdle RW #44—14B
1" = 50° SECTION 14, T7S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

DATE: 03-04-10 ’ 0
DRAWN BY: P.M. 548° FSL 645 FEL LTI
REVISED: 05—-05-10 S.L. PreconsrIclionND, ot

: 98' Gradey, 9% [ iip."%,

AJ o, o
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Slope = 1 1/2:1 |
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APPROXIMATE YARDAGES

EXCESS MATERIAL = 1,040 Cu. Yds.
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(New Construction Only) '
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B INTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
FILL - 7’ 770 CUYDS 85 So. 200 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (435) 789-1017
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QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

TYPICAL RIG LAYOUT FOR

RW #44—14B

SECTION 14, T7S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

548" FSL 645" FEL

SCALE: 1" = 50°

DATE: 03—04-10

DRAWN BY: P.M.
REVISED: 05-~05-10 S.L.

NOTE:

Flare Pit is to be
located a min. of 100"
from the Well Mead.

Total Pit Capacity
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= 5250 Bbls. £
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= 1,500 Cu. Yds.
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UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
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85 So 200 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (435) 789-1017
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QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

INTERIM RECLAMATION PLAN FOR

[FIGURE #4]

RW #44-148

SECTION 14, T7S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.
548" FSL 645" FEL

SCALE: 1” = 50'
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REVISED: 05-05-10 S.L.
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85 So. 200 East * Vernal. Utah 84078 * (435) 789—1017
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LEGEND: QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD
2 DISPOSAL WELLS & WATER WELLS N RW #44-14B
® PRODUCING WELLS -§- ABANDONED WELLS SECTION 14, T7S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.
@ SHUT IN WELLS -@ TEMPORARILY ABANDONED

548' FSL 645' FEL

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGRAPHIC|IO3]03|10
83 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 MAP v | vear C
IS ) SCALE: 1"=2000'] DRAWN BY: J.H. |REVISED: 04-29-10| 5 ¥oY o3

fONTII| DAY
(4358) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813 MO
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APPROXIMATE TOTAL PIPELINE UPGRADE DISTANCE = 4,911" +/-

LEGEND:

QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

EXISTING ROAD
EXISTING PIPELINE
——————————— PROPOSED PIPELINE

RW #44-14B
SECTION 14, T7S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.
548' FSL 645' FEL

Uintah Engineering & L.and Surveying

88 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078
(4353) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813

TOPOGRAPHICIO3]03]10

SCALE: 1"=1000] DRAWN BY: J.. |REVISED: us-ls-mm

MAP MONTH| DAV | YEAR

RECEIVED August 30, 2010




QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

RW #44-14B
SECTION 14, T7S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY, THEN SOUTHERLY DIRECTION FROM VERNAL,
UTAH ALONG U.S. HIGHWAY 40 APPROXIMATELY 3.9 MILES TO THE
JUNCTION OF STATE HIGHWAY 45; EXIT RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 17.1 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF
THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE EAST; TURN LEFT AND
PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 3.6 MILES TO THE
JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHEAST;
TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 94’ TO THE PROPOSED LOCATION.

TOTAL DISTANCE FROM VERNAL, UTAH TO THE PROPOSED WELL
LOCATION IS APPROXIMATELY 24.6 MILES.

RECEIVED August 30, 2010




API Well No: 43047152060000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

FORM 9

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING R

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
RED WASH

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
RW 44-14B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43047152060000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:

11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext RED WASH
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH
0548 FSL 0645 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: SESE Section: 14 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

D ACIDIZE !/ ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: ] cHANGE To PREVIOUS PLANS [J cHanGE TuBING [ cHANGE WELL NAME
12/15/2010
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
[l suBsEQUENT REPORT L] peepen [J FRACTURE TREAT [J NEw consTRuCTION
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON

D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL

D APD EXTENSION

OTHER: l—

D DRILLING REPORT |:| WATER SHUTOFF |:| SI TA STATUS EXTENSION

Report Date:

D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
QEP ENERGY COMPANY REQUEST APPROVAL TO CHANGE THE 4.5"
PRODUCTION CASING WEIGHT AND GRADE FROM: 4.5" 13.5# N-80 LTC
COLLAPSE: 8,450 PSI BURST: 9,020 PSI TENSILE: 270,000 Ibs (joint strength
constrained) TO:4.5" 11.6# HCP-110 LTC COLLAPSE: 8,830 PSI BURST:
10,710 PSI TENSILE:279,000 Ibs (joint strenght constrained) THE
SUBSTITUTED PIPE MEETS THE DESIGN REQUIREMENTS.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: { ™\ 12{09/291\0

AT oo

By:

PHONE NUMBER
435 781-4331

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)
Jan Nelson

TITLE
Permit Agent

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
12/8/2010

RECEIVED December 08, 2010




DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: QEP ENERGY COMPANY

Well Name: RW 44-14B

Api No: 43-047-15206 Lease Type_ FEDERAL

Section_14 Township__07S Range 23E County___ UINTAH

Drilling Contractor AZTEC RIG# __777
SPUDDED:

Date 12/16/2010

Time 8:00 AM

How ROTARY

Drilling will Commence:

Reported by DAVE HARDING

Telephone #

Date 12/16/2010 Signed CHD




STATE OF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator: _QEP Energy Company
Address: 11002 East 17500 South

Operator Account Number: N_3700

city Vernal

state UT zip 84078 Phone Number: (435) 781-4342

A umber

4304715206 RW 44-14B SESE 14 7S 23E I UINTAH

5670 /7413 10/111953 N Y.

Comments: .o\ TO MVRD

Well 2

umber ell:Nam v i unty:

4304715155 RW 43-22B UINTAH

£ | 5670 /79 j4 10/1/1953 / / G /. 90//

Comments: -orv TO MVRD

s

Woell 3

RW 33-23B

= 5670 17915 71011984 i/ ¢ /30/
: / /
Comments: :rrRv TO MVRD
ACTION CODES:
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) Dahn Caldwell
B - Add new well to existing entity {group or unit well) Narite (Pleagé'Print) ‘ ] +
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity ~ . o GKKA
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity Signature '
E - Other (Explain in ‘comments’ section) R ECE‘VED Office Administrator 1/5/2011

Title Date

3 2011
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING

(5/2000)




API Well No: 43047152060000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
U-081

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
RED WASH

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
RW 44-14B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43047152060000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext RED WASH
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH
0548 FSL 0645 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: SESE Section: 14 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING D CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
/ SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT D NEW CONSTRUCTION
2/5/20 1 1 D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT !/ PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT
. D WATER SHUTOFF D SI TA STATUS EXTENSION D APD EXTENSION
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER:

THIS WELL COMMENCED PRODUCTION ON 02/05/2011.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Jan Nelson 435 781-4331 Permit Agent
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 2/14/2011




STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIlL, GAS AND MINING

AMENDED REPORT [_]
(highlight changes)

FORM 8

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU-081

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

T2, TYPE OF WELL: oI GAS o OTHER 7 UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME
WELL WELL U 89200761X
b, TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:;
: . RE- DIFF.
e 1 RO ol A Bnrry [ RESVR. OTHER RW 44-14B
7. NAME OF OPERATOR, 5. API NUMBER.
QEP Energy Company 4304715206
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
1050 17th Street, Ste. 50(csrv Denver stare CO  zw 80265 (303) 308-3060 Red Wash
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) . ‘ 11, QTRIQTR. SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,
ATSUReAcE: 548' FSL, 645' FEL Bru Tey e el ‘ ‘
N N SESE 14 7S 23E
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVAL REPORTED BELOW: Same = \ﬁ 0D
AT TOTAL DEPT 12, COUNTY T3, STATE UTAH
ALDEPTH: -SeHR@— o .. i :
S £l DL Fel Uintah
14, DATE SPUDDED: 15, DATE T.D. REACHED; | 16. DATE COMPLETED: A 17. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, GL):
12/18/2010 12/25/2010 2/3/2011 asanpone [] resovTorropuce ] | 5 776¢ - GL
18. TOTAL DEPTH: MD B 18. PLUG BACKT.D.: MD 20, IF MULTIPLE COMPLETIONS, HOW MANY? * | 21. DEPTH BRIDGE =~ MD
10,548 (.2 10-859'?*0 PLUG SET:
™vo 10,548 921G ™o 10,859 G\ TVD
22. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICAL LOGS RUN (Submit copy of each) 2.
) , WAS WELL CORED? nofZ]  ves[]  (submitanalysis)
GR, Rt, Porosity, Sonic (Quad Combo) WAS DST RUN? ‘o ves[]  (Submt regery
DIRECTIONAL SURVEY? no[T]  ves[/]  (submitcopy)
24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in wetl)
HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE WEIGHT (#t) TOP (MD) BOTTOM () | STACE CEMENTER | CEMENT TYPES vofbkﬁ%eu CEMENT TOP ** | AMOUNT PULLED
15" 10.75" J-55 40.5# 0 302 Comnpy 245
9.875" 7" J-55 23# 0 5,935 Comrgg 550 4500 - CBL
6.125" 45" HCIy| 11.6# 0 10,862 G 520
26. TUBING RECORD
SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) | PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) | PACKER SET (MD) SizE DEPTH SET (MD) | PACKER SET (MD)
26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD
FORMATION NAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) | TOP (TVD) | BOTTOM (TVD) [ INTERVAL (Top/Bot-MD) | SIZE | NO. HOLES PERFORATION STATUS
® Mesa Verde 10,164 10,756 10,164 10,7561 5 120 foren |/] Saueezed [ ]

8) Open I:] Squeezed l:l
) Open D Squeezed D
(D)

Squeezed D

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

Open I:]

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNT AND TYPE OF MATERIAL

10,666 - 10,756

19 bbl 15% HCI, 1852 bbl slick water w/ 40,700 pounds 30/50 sand

10,304 - 10,430

19 bbl 15% HCI, 2467 bbl slick water w/ 64,000 pounds 30/50 sand

10,164 - 10,176

19 bbl 15% HCI, 1307 bbl slick water w/ 31,000 pounds 30/50 sand

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS:

] ELECTRICALMECHANICAL LOGS
[] SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGING AND CEMENT VERIFICATION

30, WELL STATUS:

[J ostrerort /] DIRECTIONAL SURVEY
1 other: Drilling Report

[] eeorocic rerorT
[ core anaLvsis

Producing

(5/2000)

RECEIVED
MAR 29 2011
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

(CONTINUED ON BACK)



31. INITIAL PRODUCTION INTERVAL A {(As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION |OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER -BBL:  |PROD, METHOD:
2/4/2011 2/9/2011 24 RATES: — 3 1,115 107 Flowing
CHOKE SIZE: |TBG.PRESS. |CSG.PRESS. [APIGRAVITY |BTU-GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION |OIL — BBL: GAS ~MCF: . |WATER-~BBL: |INTERVAL STATUS:
16/16 0 RATES: = 3 1,115 107
INTERVAL B (As shown in item #26)
DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION |OIL-BBL: GAS — MCF: WATER ~BBL:  |PROD. METHOD:
RATES: —
CHOKE SIZE: |TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. |APIGRAVITY  |BTU-GAS GAS/OIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION JOIL — BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER ~ BBL: |INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: —

INTERVAL C {As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION [OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: |PROD. METHOD:
RATES: =

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS.  |API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/QIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION JOIL — BBL: GAS — MCF: WATER - BBL: |INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: =

INTERVAL D (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION |OiL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: |PROD. METHOD:
RATES: —

CHOKE SIZE; |TBG.PRESS. [CSG.PRESS. |APIGRAVITY |BTU-GAS GAS/OIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION |OIL ~ BBL: GAS ~MCF: WATER - BBL: |INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: =

32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

33. SUMMARY OF POROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION {Log) MARKERS:

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Formation (.,I\l:g) B(o'\;tsgn Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (MeasuI:g Depth)
Green River 3,025
Wasatch 6,097
Mesa Verde 8,636

35. ADDITIONAL REMARKS (Include plugging procedure)

36. | hereby certify that the fi

going and attached inf tion is lete and t as determined from all records.

NAME (PLEASE PriNT)_Morgan Anderson mme Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE m%ﬂ /\(‘ ﬁﬂdo ﬂ .~ pate  3/17/2011

This report must be submitted within 30 days of

e completing or plugging a new well e reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
e drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore o significantly deepening an existing well bora below the previous bottom-hole depth
e recompleting to a different producing formation e drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM 20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from two or more formations.

**|ITEM 24: Cement Top — Show how reported top(s) of cement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL), cement bond log (CBL), temperature survey (TS)).

Send to: Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(5/2000)



AED,

dxr
RW 44-14B Native Def. Gyro Survey Survey Report
Report Date: March 3, 2011 Survey | DLS Computation Method:  Minimum Curvature / Lubinski
Client: QEP ENERGY Vertical Section Azimuth: 145.580°
Field: Uinta Vertical Section Origin: N 0.000 ft, E 0,000 ft
Structure / Slot: Red Wash / RW 44-14B TVD Reference Datum: KB
-Well: RW 44-14B TVD Reference Elevation: 5789.3 ft relative to MSL
Borehole: Re-Entry Sea Bed / Ground Level Elevation: 5643.300 ft relative to MSL
UWIAPI: Magnetic Declination: 11,072°
Survey Name / Date: RW 44-14B Native Def, Gyro Survey / January 5, 2011 Total Field Strength: 52506.471 nT
Tort/{ AHD / DDI / ERD ratio: 34.344° / 508.43 ft / 4.243 / 0.047 Magnetic Dip:  66.088°
Grid Coordinate System: NADB83 Utah State Planes, Central Zone, US Feet Declination Date: January 05, 2011
Location LatiLong: N 4012 13.610, W 10917 13.890 Magnetic Declination Model: IGRF 2010
Location Grid NJE YIX: N 7250597.520 ftUS, E 2258404.107 ftUS North Reference: True North
Grid Convergence Angle: +1.41747766° Total Corr Mag North -> True North:  +11.072°
Grid Scale Factor:  (.99991949 Local Coordinates Referenced To: Well Head
Comments M;Z;‘::‘e" Inclination | Azimuth D ‘s’:zf:n' NS EW DLS Northing Easting Latitude Longitude
(ft) (deg) (deg) (ft) (ft) (ft) {ft) {degi00 ft) (ftUs) (ftus)
Tie-In 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 7250597.52 2258404.11 N 4012 13.610 W 109 17 13.890
39.00 0.47 253.53 39.00 -0.05 -0.05 -0.15 1.21  7250597.47 2258403.95 N 4012 13.610 W 109 17 13.892
114.00 0.38 226.95 114.00 -0.11 -0.30 -0.63 0.29 7250597.20 2258403.48 N 4012 13.607 W 109 17 13.898
214.00 0.44 160.74 214.00 0.31 -0.89 -0.75 0.45 7250596.61 2258403.38 N 4012 13.601 W 109 17 13.800
314.00 0.33 159.05 313.99 0.96 -1.52 -0.52 0.11  7250595.99 2258403.63 N 4012 13.595 W 109 17 13.897
414.00 0.58 139.22 413.99 1.75 -2.17 -0.08 0.29 7250595.34 2258404.08 N 4012 13.589 W 109 17 13.891
514.00 0.53 139.68 513.99 2.71 -2.91 0.55 0.05 7250594.62 2258404.73 N 401213.581 W 109 17 13.883
614.00 0.50 156.15 613.98 3.60 -3.66 1.02 0.15 7250593.88 2258405.22 N 40 12 13.574 W 109 17 13.877
714.00 0.67 156.89 713.98 4.60 -4.60 1.43 0.17 7250592.96 2258405.65 N 40 12 13.565 W 109 17 13.872
814.00 0.49 165.87 813.97 5.58 -5.55 1.76 0.20 7250592.01 2258406.01 N 40 12 13.555 W 109 17 13.867
914.00 0.65 170.07 913.97 6.49 -8.53 1.96 0.17 7250591.05 2258406.23 N 40 12 13.546 W 109 17 13.865
1014.00 0.48 179.88 1013.96 7.36 ~7.50 2.06 0.19 7250590.07 2258406.36 N 40 1213.536 W 109 17 13.863
1114.00 0.31 189.80 1113.96 7.90 -8.19 2.02 0.18 7250589.39 2258406.33 N 4012 13.529 W 109 17 13.864
1214.00 0.24 194.02 1213.96 8.23 -8.66 1.92 0.07 7250588.91 2258406.24 N 4012 13.524 W 109 17 13.865
1314.00 0.27 206.63 1313.96 8.48 -9.07 1.77 0.06 7250588.50 2258406.10 N 401213.520 W 109 17 13.867
1414.00 0.28 189.10 1413.96 8.77 -9.52 1.62 0.08 7250588.04 225840596 N 4012 13.516 W 109 17 13.869
1514.00 0.34 190.25 1513.95 9.16 -10.06 1.53 0.06 7250587.50 2258405.88 N 401213.511 W 109 17 13.870
1614.00 0.32 182.53 1613.95 9.59 -10.63 1.46 0.05 7250586.93 2258405.83 N 40 12 13.505 W 109 17 13.871
1714.00 0.29 190.90 1713.95 10.00 -11.16 1.40 0.05 7250586.40 2258405.79 N 4012 13.500 W 109 17 13.872
1814.00 0.24 189.66 1813.95 10.32 -11.61 1.32 0.05 7250585.95 2258405.71 N 4012 13.495 W 10917 13.873
1914.00 0.22 194.60 1913.85 10.60 -12.00 1.24 0.03 7250585.55 2258405.64 N 4012 13.491 W 109 17 13.874
2014.00 0.26 198.92 2013.95 10.86 -12.40 1.12 0.04 7250585.15 2258405.53 N 40 12 13.487 W 109 17 13.876
2114.00 0.25 196.85 2113.95 11.13 -12.83 0.98 0.01 7250584.72 2258405.40 N 40 12 13.483 W 109 17 13.877
2214.00 0.19 186.80 2213.95 11.40 -13.20 0.90 0.07 7250584.35 2258405.33 N 4012 13.480 W 109 17 13.878
2314.00 0.15 191.88 2313.95 11.61 -13.49 0.85 0.04 7250584.05 2258405.29 N 4012 13.477 W 109 17 13.879
2414.00 0.18 191.59 241395 11.81 -13.77 0.79 0.03 725058377 2258405.24 N 4012 13.474 W 109 17 13.880
2514.00 0.15 179.09 2513.95 12.03 -14.06 0.76 0.05 7250583.49 2258405.22 N 4012 13.471 W 109 17 13.880
2614.00 0.15 177.05 2613.94 12.25 -14.32 0.77 0.01 7250583.22 2258405.23 N 401213.468 W 109 17 13.880
2714.00 0.13 152.60 2713.94 12.47 -14.55 0.83 0.06 7250582.99 2258405.30 N 4012 13.466 W 109 17 13.879
2814.00 0.20 139.41 2813.94 12.76 -14.79 1.00 0.08 7250582.76 225840547 N 4012 13.464 W 109 17 13.877
2914.00 0.26 125.88 2913.94 13.15 -15.05 1.29 0.08 7250582.51 2258405.77 N 40 1213.461 W 109 17 13.873
3014.00 0.29 110.25 3013.94 13.57 -15.27 1.71 0.08 7250582.30 2258406.20 N 4012 13.459 W 109 17 13.868
3114.00 0.39 142.06 3113.94 14.11 -15.63 2.16 0.21 7250581.95 2258406.65 N 40 1213.456 W 109 17 13.862
3214.00 0.59 144.88 3213.94 14.97 -16.32 2.67 0.20 7250581.28 2258407.18 N 4012 13.449 W 109 17 13.856
3314.00 0.60 150.24 3313.93 16.00 -17.19 3.22 0.06 7250580.41 2258407.75 N 4012 13.440 W 109 17 13.848
3414.00 0.62 142.67 3413.93 17.07 -18.08 3.81 0.08 7250579.54 2258408.36 N 4012 13.431 W 109 17 13.841
3514.00 0.82 150.86 3513.92 18.32 -18.13 4.49 0.22 7250578.51 2258409.06 N401213.421 W 109 17 13.832
3614.00 1.22 157.45 3613.90 20.07 -20.74 5.24 0.42 7250576.92 2258409.86 N 4012 13.405 W 109 17 13.822
3714.00 1.38 153.04 3713.88 22.31 -22.80 6.20 0.19 7250574.88 2258410.87 N 401213.385 W 109 17 13.810
3814.00 1.63 152.30 3813.84 24,92 -2513 7.40 0.25 7250572.58 2258412.13 N 401213.362 W 109 17 13.795
3914.00 2.03 153.89 3913.79 28.08 -27.98 8.84 0.40 7250569.77 2258413.64 N 401213.334 W 10917 13.776
4014.00 1.96 149.44 4013.73 31.54 -31.04 10.49 0.17 7250566.75 2258415.36 - N 40 12 13.303 W 109 17 13.755
4114.00 2.01 146.56 4113.67 35.00 -33.98 12.33 0.11 7250563.86 2258417.27 N 401213.274 W 109 17 13.731
4214.00 2.03 141.67 4213.61 38.52 -36.83 14.39 0.17 7250561.06 225841941 N 4012 13.246 W 109 17 13.704
4314.00 1.92 128.36 4313.55 41.89 -39.26 16.81 0.47 7250558.69 2258421.88 N 40 1213.222 W 109 17 13.673
4414.00 1.79 115.53 4413.50 44.84 -40,97 19.53 0.43 7250557.05 225842464 N 4012 13.205 W 109 17 13.638
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To MD

4514.00
4614.00
4714.00
4814.00

4914.00
5014.00
5114.00
5§214.00
5314.00

5414.00
5514.00
5614.00
5714.00
5814.00

5814.00
6014.00
6114.00
6214.00
6314.00

6414.00
6514.00
6614.00
6714.00
6814.00

6914.00
7014.00
7114.00
7214.00
7314.00

7414.00
7514.00
7614.00
7714.00
7814.00

7914.00
8014.00
8114.00
8214.00
8314.00

8414.00
8514.00
8614.00
8714.00
8814.00

8914.00
9014.00
9114.00
9214.00
9314.00

9414.00
9514.00
9614.00
9714.00
9814.00

9914.00
10014.00
10114.00
10214.00
10314.00

10414.00
10514.00
10614.00
10714.00
10814.00

10830.00
10862.00

1.97
1.85
1.57
1.50

1.18
1.19
1.34
1.23
1.18

1.05
1.09
1.07
1.13
1.17

1.15
1.19
1.52
1.95
219

2.53
2.95
3.64
4.32
5.22

6.15
7.07
7.51
7.87
7.83

7.54
7.26
7.02
6.80
6.75

6.99
7.25
7.80
8.23
8.80

9.04
8.93
7.70
5.54
4.27

3.97
4.20
4.44
4.24
3.80

3.84
3.30
2.81
2.49
2.44

2.39
2.22
2.91
3.65
4.27

4.68
4.49
4.22
4.29
4.14

4.22
4.22
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109.16
105.33
102.94
101.97

106.82
112.13
118.23
114.64
113.75

128.44
133.09
133.19
137.56
142.94

140.24
142.40
151.76
155.61
151.46

146.46
146.07
147.46
148.33
148.05

14912
148.43
147.57
149.44
150.23

150.39
150.65
151.07
151.19
151.22

149.52
148.89
148.93
149.17
147.63

146.48
148.31
156.36
160.60
153.15

153.22
150.03
142.03
140.51
133.54

138.53
137.10
138.45
140.77
139.95

146.97
151.34
146.61
139.37
131.45

132.08
130.95
133.02
133.42
142.21

142.66
142.66
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4513.44
4613.39
4713.34
4813.31

4913.28
5013.26
5113.23
5213.21
5313.19

5413.17
5513.15
5613.13
5713.11
5813.09

5913.07
6013.05
6113.02
6212.98
6312.91

6412.83
6512.71
6612.55
6712.31
6811.96

6911.47
7010.80
7109.99
7209.09
7308.16

7407.26
7506.42
7605.65
7704.92
7804.22

7903.51
8002.73
8101.87
8200.90
8299.79

8398.58
8497.36
8596.31
8695.64
8795.27

8895.01
8994.76
9094.47
919419
9293.93

9393.71
9493.51
9593.37
9693.26
9793.17

9893.08
9993.00
10092.90
10192.74
10292.50

10392.19
10491.87
10591.58
10691.31
10791.04

10807.00
10838.91

47.57
50.19
52.43
54.38

56.13
57.80
59.71
61.67
63.46

65.21
67.02
68.86
70.75
72.74

74.76
76.80
79.15
82.15
85.72

89.83
94.61
100.36
107.29
1156.59

125.48
136.97
149.65
163.01
176.63

189.96
202.79
21517
227.14
238.88

250.80
263.17
276.25
290.16
304.95

320.45
336.06
350.39
361.64
369.99

377.11
384.20
391.71
399.26
406.26

412.91
419.08
424.36
428.96
433.24

437.44
441.46
445.92
451.62
458.40

465.98
473.73
481.11
488.36
495.62

496.78
499.13

NS

-42.21
-43.20
-43.93
-44 .51

-45.08
-45.77
-46.72
-47.72
-48.58

-49.56
-50.78
-52.07
-53.44
-54.98

-56.57
-58.16
-60.15
-62.87
-66.10

-69.62
-73.59
-78.40
-84.28
-91.39

-99.89
-109.73
-120.49
-131.90
-143.71

-165.32
-166.54
-177.39
-187.93
-198.27

~208.66
-219.31
-230.52
-242.48
-255.09

-268.10
-281.25
-293.99
-304.69
-312.56

-318.97
-325.23
-331.46
-337.36
-342.56

-347.41
-352.03
-355.97
-359.49
-362.80

-366.18
-369.62
-373.44
-377.98
-382.86

-388.06
-393.36
-398.43
-403.51
-408.94

-409.86
-411.73

Efw
22.56
25.74
28.63
31.25

33.52
35.46
37.46
39.46
41.38

43.04
44.45
45.83
47.17
48.45

49.71
50.99
52.256
53.58
55.19

57.33
59.98
63.13
66.81
71.13

76.22
82.19
88.91
95.90
102.76

109.39
115.72
121.78
127.59
133.27

139.19
145.53
152.2¢
159.46
167.23

175.66
184.08
190.84
195.13
1988.42

201.66
205.05
209.26
213.99
218.81

223.49
227.67
231.25
234.25
236.99

239.50
241.57
243.89
247.36
252.22

258.04
264.03
269.67
275.08
280.01

280.72
282.156

0.28

0.29
0.07

0.34
0.1
0.20
0.14
0.05

0.31
0.10
0.02
0.10
0.12

0.06
0.08
0.40
0.45
0.28

0.40
0.42
0.69
0.68
0.0

0.93
0.92
0.45
0.44
0.12

0.29
0.28
0.25
0.22
0.05

0.31
0.27
0.55
0.43
0.61

0.30
0.31
1.69
221
1.42

0.30
0.32
0.65
0.23
0.60

0.34
0.55
0.50
0.34
0.06

0.30
0.24
0.72
0.85
0.83

0.41
0.21
0.31
0.08
0.66

0.54
0.00

7250555.88
7250554.97
7250554.31
7250553.80

7250553.28
7250552.64
7250551.75
7250550.80
7250549.98

7250549.04
7250547.86
7250546.60
7250545.27
7250543.76

7250542.21
7250540.64
7250538.68
7250536.00
7250532.81

7250529.35
7250525.44
7250520.71
7250514.92
7250507.92

7250499.56
7250489.87
7250479.28
7250468.04
7250456.41

7250444.96
7250433.91
7250423.21
7250412.82
7250402.63

7250392.38
7250381.90
7250370.85
7250359.08
7250346.67

7250333.87
7250320.93
7250308.36
7250297.78
7250289.99

7250283.66
7250277.48
7250271.37
7250265.58
7250260.51

7250255.77
7250251.26
7250247 .41
7250243.97
7250240.72

7250237.41
72502.34.01
7250230.25
7250225.81
7250221.05

7250216.00
7250210.85
7250205.91
7250200.97
7250195.67

7250194.76
7250192.93

2258427.70
2258430.91
2258433.82
2258436.45

2258438.73
2258440.69
2258442.70
2258444.73
2258446.67

2258448.36
2258449.80
2258451.20
2258452.58
2258453.90

2258455.20
2258456.51
2258457.82
2258459.22
2258460.91

2258463.13
2258465.89
2258469.15
2258472.98
2258477.47

2258482.76
2258488.98
2258495.97
2258503.23
2258510.38

2258517.29
2258523.91
2258530.23
2258536.29
2258542.23

2258548.40
2258555.01
2258562.04
2258569.51
2258577.58

2258586.33
2258595.07
2258602.15
2258606.70
2258610.18

2258613.58
2258617.12
2258621.48
2258626.36
2258631.30

2258636.10

2258640.39

2258644.07
2258647.16
2258649.98

2258652.57
2258654.72
2258657.14
2258660.72
2258665.70

2258671.65
2258677.76
2258683.53
2258689.06
2258694.12

2258694.86
2258696.33

N 4012 13.193
N 40 12 13.183
N 4012 13.176
N 4012 13.170

N 4012 13.164
N 4012 13.158
N 4012 13.148
N 40 12 13.138
N 401213.130

N 4012 13.120
N 4012 13.108
N 40 12 13.095
N 4012 13.082
N 40 12 13.067

N 40 12 13.051
N 40 12 13.035
N 4012 13.016
N 4012 12.989
N 40 12 12.957

N 40 12 12.922
N 4012 12.883
N 40 12 12.835
N 401212.777
N 40 12 12.707

N 401212623
N 40 12 12.526
N 4012 12.419
N 40 12 12.307
N 4012 12.190

N 40 12 12.075
N 4012 11.964
N 40 12 11.857
N 4012 11.753
N 4012 11.651

N 40 12 11.548
N 4012 11.443
N 40 12 11.332
N 4012 11.214
N 40 12 11.089

N 40 12 10.961
N 4012 10.831
N 40 12 10.705
N 40 12 10.599
N 40 12 10.521

N 40 12 10.458
N 40 12 10.396
N 40 12 10.335
N 40 12 10.276
N 4012 10.225

N 40 12 10.177
N 4012 10.131
N 40 12 10.092
N 40 12 10.058
N 40 12 10.025

N 40 12 9.991
N 40 12 9.957
N 40.12 9.920
N 40 129.875
N 4012 9.827

N 40129.775
N 40129.723
N 4012 9.673
N 40 12 9.622
N 40 12 9.568

N 40 12 9.560
N40129.541

W 108 17 13.599
W 109 17 13.558
W 109 17 13.521
W 109 17 13.487

W 109 17 13.458
W 109 17 13.433
W 109 17 13.407
W 109 17 13.381
W 109 17 13.357

W 109 17 13.335
W 109 17 13.317
W 109 17 13.299
W 109 17 13.282
W 109 17 13.266

W 109 17 13.249
W 109 17 13.233
W 109 17 13.217
W 108 17 13.199
W 109 17 13.179

W 109 17 13.151
W 109 17 13.117
W 109 17 13.076
W 109 17 13.029
W 109 17 12.973

W 109 17 12.808
W 109 17 12.831
W 109 17 12.744
W 109 17 12.654
W 109 17 12.566

W 109 17 12.480
W 109 17 12.399
W 109 17 12.321
W 109 17 12.246
W 109 17 12.172

W 109 17 12.096
W 109 17 12.014
W 109 17 11.927
W 109 17 11.835
W 109 17 11.735

W 109 17 11.626
W 109 17 11.518
W 109 17 11.430
W 109 17 11.375
W 109 17 11.333

W 109 17 11.291
W 109 17 11.247
W 109 17 11.193
W 109 17 11.132
W 109 17 11.070

W 109 17 11.010
W 109 17 10.956
W 109 17 10.910
W 109 17 10.871
W 109 17 10.836

W 109 17 10.803
W 109 17 10.777
W 109 17 10.747
W 109 17 10.702
W 109 17 10.639

W 109 17 10.564
W 109 17 10.487
W 109 17 10.414
W 109 17 10.345
W 109 17 10.281

W 109 17 10.272
W 109 17 10.254
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Survey Type: Definitive Survey

Survey Error Model: SLB ISCWSA version 22 *** 3-D 95.00% Confidence 2.7955 sigma

Surveying Proq:
MD From ( ft) MD To (ft) EOU Freq Survey Tool Type Borehole -> Survey
0.00 146.00 Act-Stns SLB_CNSG+CASING-Depth Only  Re-Entry -> RW 44-14B Native Def. Gyro Survey
146.00 10830.00 Act-Stns SLB_CNSG+CASING Re-Entry -> RW 44-14B Native Def. Gyro Survey

*ltalicized stations are NOT used in position calculations.
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RWU 44-14B (84)

Spud Date:  6/9/1958

Location: 14-7-S 23-E 26 Rig Release: 12/3/2010
Rig Name: ROCKY MTN WS Rig Number: 3
Date From - To | Hours | Code ngdbe , Description:of Operations
11/8/2010  [10:00 - 11:30 1.50/LOC |4 MOL & RIG UP WELL SERVICE UNIT & GIRC EQUIPMENT.
11:30 - 14:00 250 HOT |1 R/U ADLER HOT-OILER & CIRC 150 BBLS 250 DEGREE CHEMICAL WATER DN
CSG. UN-SEAT PUMP & FLUSH RODS W/ 50 BBLS OF THE SAME.
14:00 - 17:00 300/ TRP |6 POOH LAYING DN 30' - 1 1/2" POLISH ROD, 2-1" X 6' PONY RODS, 204- 3/4"
PLAIN RODS & 2.5 X 1.5 X 14X17 RHAC PUMP. SWIFN
17:00 - 18:30 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY
11/9/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION  S8TP=0 PSI, SICP=50 PSI
07:00 - 09:00 2.00|WHD |2 N/D TREE.
09:00 - 11:00 2.00|FISH |6 TRY TO RELEASE OR SHEAR 7" TBG ANCHOR @ 5142', WITH NO SUCCESS.
PULLED 80,000# & ROTATED PIPE TO RIGHT TRYING TO RELEASE ANCHOR.
11:00 - 12:00 1.00|BOP |1 N/U BOP
12:00 - 16:30 450|FISH |4 R/U WIRELINE & RUN FREE-POINT TOOLS. PIPE WAS FREE 10' ABOVE
ANCHOR. DISCHARGE STRING SHOT ACROSS TBG ANCHOR @ 5141'-
COULD NOT RELEASE ANCHOR. CHEMICAL CUT TBG 5' ABOVE ANCHOR @
5135', R/D WIRELINE.
16:30 - 17:00 0.50| TRP |2 POOH W/ 2 7/8" TBG TO 4500' SWIFN
17:00 - 18:30 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY
11/10/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION SICP= 0 PSI, SITP= 0 PSI
07:00 - 09:00 2.00[TRP |2 FINISH POOH W/ 165 JTS 2 7/8" PROD TBG & 22' CUT-OFF JT. TOTAL= 5122
09:00 - 12:00 3.00/FISH |5 PICK-UP 6 1/8" WASHOVER SHOE,JARS, BS, 2-4 3/4" DC'S & RIH TO 5045'.
12:00 - 15:00 3.00|FISH {2 R/U PWR SWIVEL & CLEAN OUT SCALE F/ 5045' - TOP OF 7" ANCHOR @ 5140'
CIRC CLEAN & R/D SWIVEL
15:00 - 16:30 1.50|TRP |2 POOH W/ CLEAN OUT ASSY TO 650'. SWIFN
16:30 - 18:00 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY
11/11/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION SICP=0 PSI, SITP=0 PSI
07:00 - 07:30 050/ TRP |2 FINISH POOH W/ 6 1/8" WASHOVER ASSY.
07:30 - 10:00 250/ TRP |2 RIH W/ 2 7/8" OVERSHOT,JARS,BS,2-4 3/4" DC'S, INTENSIFIER & 2 7/8" TBG.
10:00 - 11:00 1.00|FISH |3 ENGAGE FISHTOP @ 5135' & JAR FISH FREE.
11:00 - 13:00 2.00|TRP |4 POOH LAYING DN FISHING TOOLS & FISH. ( 52 7/8" TBG, 7" TBG ANCHOR,
SEAT NIPPLE & 4 1/2" SLOTTED MUD ANCHOR) ALL FISH RECOVERED.
13:00 - 14:30 150/ TRP |2 RIH W/ 7" PKR, BALL-TEST SUB & 2 7/8" TBG TO 4400'
14:30 - 16:00 1.50|EQT |1 SET PKR @ 4400' & TEST CSG TO 1600 PSI / 5 MIN-HELD. RIH TO 4865.DROP
BALL & TEST TBG TO 2000 PSI-HELD. CIRC OUT BALL. SET PKR @ 4865.
PUMP INTO PERFS F/4948-5163 @1.0BPM & 800 PSI-NO COMMUNICATION.
PUMP INTO PERFS F/ 4562-4832 @ 2.0 BPM & 600 PSI- NO COMMUNICATION.
SWIFN
16:00 - 17:30 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY
11/12/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION  SITP= 0 PS|, SICP=0 PS|
07:00 - 15:00 8.00|CMT |3 W/ 7" PKR SET @ 4865' R/U HES & SQUEEZE PERFS @ 4948-5163 W/ 80 SX
TYPE 3 NEAT CEMENT. RE-SET PKR @ 4400' & SQUEEZE PERFS @
4562-4832 W/ 81 SX TYPE 3 NEAT CEMENT. POOH TO 4100'. REVERSE OUT
TBG & RE-SET PKR @4100' & PRESS TBG TO 1500 PSI - SWIFWE.
15:00 - 16:30 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY '
11/15/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION SICP= 0 PS1, SITP= 0 PS|
07:00 - 08:30 1.50| TRP |2 RELEASE 7" PKR @ 4100' POOH W/ PKR & 2 7/8" TBG.,
08:30 - 10:30 200(TRP |2 RIH W/ 6 1/8" ROCK BIT & 2 7/8" TBG. TAG CEMENT @ 4440'. TEST CSG TO
750 PSI-HELD.
10:30 - 17:00 6.50|DRL |4 R/U DRLG EQUIPMENT & DRILL OUT CEMENT F/ 4440- 4680". CIRC CLEAN &
PULL UP TO 4650". DRAIN UP & SWIFN.
17:00 - 18:30 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY
11/16/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION. SICP= 0 PSI, SITP= 0 PS|
07:00 - 11:00 400|DRL |4 R/U DRLG EQUIPMENT & DRILL OUT CEMENT F/ 4680-4840. -
11:00 - 11:30 0.50|EQT |1 CIRC CLEAN & TEST SQUEEZE TO 550 PSI /5 MIN.-LOST 20 PSI.
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~ Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RWU 44-14B (84)

Spud Date:  6/9/1958

Location:  14-7-S 23-E 26 Rig Release: 12/3/2010
Rig Name: ROCKY MTN WS Rig Number: 3
Date From - To | Hours | Code CSoudbe Description of Operations .
11/16/2010  [11:30 - 16:30 5.00|DRL |4 RIH & DRILL OUT CEMENT F/ 4894- 5048',
16:30 - 17:00 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRC WELL CLEAN & PULL UP TO 5015'. SWIFN & DRAIN UP.
17:00 - 18:30 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY
11/17/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION. SICP= 0 P8I, SITP= 0 PS|
07:00 - 15:00 8.00{DRL |4 R/U DRLG EQUIPMENT & DRLL QUT CEMENT F/ 5048-5165. CIRC CLEAN &
TEST SQUEEZE TO 550 PSI/ 15 MIN-HELD. DRILL OUT CEMENT F/ 5181-5190.
DRILL ON 7" CIBP @ 5190, BUT MAKING NO PROGRESS W/ BIT. POOH TO
4550 & SWIFN. DRAIN UP.
15:00 - 17:00 2.00(RIG 6 INSTALL NEW DRLG LINE ON RIG.
17:00 - 18:30 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY
11/18/2010  {05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION. SICP=0 PSI, SITP=0 PSI
07:00 - 08:30 1.50| TRP 10 POOH W/ 6 1/8" BIT.
08:30 - 10:30 2.00|TRP |2 RIH W/ 6 1/8" JUNK MILL & 2 7/8" TBG. TAG 7" CIBP @ 5190'
10:30 - 16:00 550/ DRL |4 R/U DRLG EQUIPMENT & DRILL UP CIBP @ 5190". RIH & TAG @ 5578". DRILL
ON CIBP REMAINS @ 5578'.
16:00 - 16:30 0.50| CIRC |1 CIRC CLEAN & PULL ABOVE OPEN PERFS TO 5200'. SWIFN & DRAIN UP.
16:30 - 18:00 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY
11/19/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION. SICP= 0 PSI, SITP= 20 PSI
07:00 - 07:30 0.50| TRP |2 RIH F/ 5200". TAG @ 5578'. R/U DRLG EQUIPMENT.
07:30 - 15:30 8.00|FISH i1 MILLING ON CSG OBSTRUCTION F/ 5578"- 5585'. MILLED UP ADDITIONAL 7"
CIBP @ 5585'. RIH TO 5620' & CIRC CLEAN.
15:30 - 16:00 0.50| TRP |2 PULL ABOVE PERFS TO 5200' & SWIFWE. DRAIN UP
16:00 - 17:30 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY
11/22/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION SITP= 50 PSI, SICP= 50 PSI
07:00 - 07:30 0.50| TRP |2 RIH F/5200' W/ 6 1/8" MILL. TAG @ 5775'
07:30 - 12:00 450|FISH |1 R/U DRLG EQUIPMENT & MILL ON OBSTRUCTION F/ 5775-5778". MILL
PLUGGING UP & QUIT DRLG.
12:00 - 14:30 250{TRP {2 POOH W/ MILL. (TBG PLUGGED)
14:30 - 16:30 2.00|TRP |2 RIH W/ NEW 6 1/8" BIT & 2 7/8" TBG TO 5700'. SWIFN & DRAIN UP.
16:30 - 18:00 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY
11/23/2010  {05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION. SICP= 0 PSI, SITP=0 PSI
07.00 - 11:30 450(DRL |4 R/U DRLG EQUIPMENT. DRILL OUT 7" CSG F/ 5778- BTM PERF @ 5835'. TBG
PLUGGED UP @ 5835'
11:30 - 13:00 150/ TRP |2 POOH W/ TBG & 6 1/8" BIT.
13:00 - 15:00 2.00|TRP |2 RIH W/ WEATHERFORD 7" HD PKR & 2 7/8" TBG. :
15:00 - 16:00 1.00|EQT |1 SET PKR @ 5175' & PUMP INTO PERFS F/ 5206-5835 @ 2.5 BPM & 400 PSI.
RELEASE PKR & SWIFWE. DRAIN UP
16:00 - 17:30 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY
11/29/2010  {05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION. SICP= 0 PSI, SITP=0 PSI
07:00 - 09:00 2.00|DEQ |2 RIH & SET 7" HD PKR @ 5395'. PUMP INTO PERFS F/5552-5835 @ 3.0 BPM &
450 PSI. PRESS UP ON PERFS F/5206-5242 TO 550 PSI. BLED DOWN TO 450
PSI/5 MIN.
09:00 - 16:00 7.00|CMT |3 R/U HES & SQUEEZE PERFS F/ 5552'-5835' W/ 204 SX TYPE 3 CEMENT. FINAL
PRESS=1920 PSi. RESET PKR @ 5175' & SQUEEZE PERFS F/5206'-5242' W/ 20
SX TYPE 3 CEMENT. FINAL PRESS= 1500 PSI.
16:00 - 17:00 1.00| TRP |2 RELEASE PKR & POOH TO 4810". SWIFN, R/D HES & DRAIN UP.
17:00 - 18:30 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY
11/30/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION. SICP= 0 PSI, SITP= 0 PSI
07:00 - 08:00 1.00| RIG 5 THAW OUT WELLHEAD & BOP.
08:00 - 10:00 2.00|TRP |2 POOH W/ 7" PKR & 2 7/8" TBG.
10:00 - 12:00 2.00|TRP |2 RIH W/ 6 1/8" PDC BIT & 2 7/8" TBG. TAG CEMENT @ 5395'.
12:00 - 15:30 3.50|DRL |4 R/U DRLG EQUIPMENT & DRILL OUT CEMENT TO 5427'. TEST CSG TO 550

PSI/ 5 MIN-HELD. RESUME DRLG CEMENT F/ 5427'-5620'.
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Well Name: RWU 44-14B (84)

Spud Date:  6/9/1958

Location: 14-7-S 23-E 26 Rig Release: 12/3/2010
Rig Name: ROCKY MTN WS Rig Number: 3
: 18ub- Gl o '
Date From - To | Hours |- Code Codel| Description of Operations
11/30/2010  [15:30 - 17:00 1.50{CIRC |1 CIRC WELL CLEAN. PULL 5 STDS TO 5310". SWIFN & DRAIN UP.
17:00 - 18:30 150 TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY
12/1/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV  [1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION. SICP= 0 PSI, SITP= 0 PS|
07:00 - 11:00 400(DRL |4 RIH F/ 5310' R/U DRLG EQUIPMENT & DRILL OUT CEMENT F/ 5620'-5785". RIH
& TAG @5835'.
11:00 - 12:30 150 EQT |1 CIRC CLEAN & TEST SQUEEZE TO 550 PSI / 30 MIN. FINAL PRESS = 380 PSI.
12:30 - 14:30 2.00|TRP |10 POOH W/ 6 1/8" PDC BIT.
14:30 - 16:30 2.00{TRP |10 RIH W/ 6 1/8" ROCK BIT & 2 7/8" TBG TO 5810'. R/U DRLG EQUIPMENT &
SWIFN. DRAIN UP.
16:30 - 18:00 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY
12/2/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO LOCATION. SICP= 0 PSI, SITP=0 PSI
07:00 - 13:00 6.00|DRL |4 DRILL OUT 7" CSG F/ 5835-5920". DRILL UP 7" CSG SHOE @ 5920' & DRILL 6
1/8" OPEN HOLE TO 5927'. CIRC CLEAN.
13:00 - 13:30 0.50|TRP |2 POOH TO 5000'
13:30 - 15:00 150 HOT |1 R/U HOT-OILER & CIRC 150 BBLS 225 DEGREE KCL WATER DN CSG TO
CLEAN WELLBORE.
15:00 - 16:15 125|TRP |2 FINISH POOH W/ 6 1/8" BIT & TBG.
16:15 - 17:30 125/ LOG |4 R/U WIRELINE & SET 7" COMPOSITE BP @ 4408'. (WITNESSED BY RYAN
ANGUS) R/D WIRELINE, SWIFN & DRAIN UP.
17:30 - 19:00 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY
12/3/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY SICP= 0 PS|
07:00 - 09:00 200|TRP |2 RIH W/ 2 7/8" TBG TO 7" CBP & 4408".
09:00 - 10:00 1.00{CIRC |1 CIRC WELL CLEAN.
10:00 - 13:00 3.00{TRP |5 LAY DN ALL 2 7/8" TBG.
13:00 - 14:00 1.00|BOP |1 N/D BOP & N/U WELLHEAD. SHUT-IN WELL.
14:00 - 17:00 3.00{LOC |4 R/D WELL SERVICE UNIT & CIRC EQUIPMENT. MOVE OFF LOCATION.
17:00 - 18:30 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO RANGELY
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Well Name: RWU 44-14B (84) Spud Date:  6/9/1958

Location:  14-7-S 23-E 26 Rig Release: 12/27/2010
Rig Name: AZTEC Rig Number: 777
Date From:- To:| Hours | Code gbudbe : Description of Operations -

12/16/2010  |06:00 - 18:00 12.00| LOC
18:00 - 06:00 12.00|LOC
12/17/2010 | 06:00 - 22:00 16.00| LOC
22:00 - 03:30 5.50| BOP
03:30 - 06:00 2.50|BOP

RIG DOWN AND MOVE RIG

DRY WATCH AND WAIT ON DAYLIGHT

HELD PJSM/MOVE RIG AND RIG UP.

NIPPLE UP BOP

HELD PJSM/TEST BOP, TESTED | BOP, TIW, PIPE RAMS. LOW 250 PSI, HIGH
5000 PSI. NOTIFIED CADE TAYLOR WITH BLM BY VOICE MAIL OF BOP TEST
12/18/2010  |06:00 - 08:00 2.00| BOP 2 TEST BOP, TESTED BLIND RAMS , PIPE RAMS, HCR, CHOKE LINE,

INSIDE BOP, CHOKE MANIFOLD, UPPER AND LOWER KELLY COCK,

AND WEAR BUSHING TO 250 PSI LOW, AND 5000 PS| HIGH PRESSURE.
TESTED HYDRILL TO 250 PSI LOW AND 2500 HIGH PRESSURE.

TESTED CASING TO 1500 PSI FOR 30 MINS.

N = b A

08:00 - 08:30 0.50{ OTH INSTALL WEAR BUSHING

08:30 - 11:00 2.50| TRP 1 PREP AND STRAP HBA, MUD MOTOR, MONEL DC, TELEDRIFT AND HWDP
11:00 - 12:00 1.00| TRP 1 PJSM AND RIG UP PICK UP CREW FOT BHA AND DRILL PIPE

12:00 - 15:00 3.00| TRP 1 PICK UP BHA

15:00 - 16:00 1.00| TRP 2 SET OUT AND STRAP DRILL PIPE

16:00 - 16:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE

16:30 - 17:00 0.50| RIG 2 WORK ON DAPTECK
17:00 - 21:00 4.00| TRP 2 PICK UP DRILL PIPE
21:00 - 22:30 1.50{ DRL 5 DRILL COMPOSITE BRIDGE PLUG AT 4351
22:30 - 00:30 2.00| TRP 2 PICK UP DRILL PIPE
00:30 - 01:30 1.00; TRP 2 RIG DOWN PICK UP CREW AND LAY DOWN MACHINE
01:30 - 03:30 2.00|RIG 6 CUT DRILLING LINE
03:30 - 04:30 1.00| EQT 2 DRILL 8 FT AND FIT TO 10.2 EMW
04:30 - 06:00 1.50| DRL 1 DRILLING 5901-5975, 250 GPM, 125 RPM, 8-10K ON BIT, .26 RPG MUD MOTOR
12/19/2010  |06:00 - 09:00 3.00{ DRL 1 DRILL FROM 5975 TO 6229, 254 FT= 84.6 FPH.
240 GPM, 125 RPM, 10 - 12 K ON BIT, .26 RPG MUD MOTOR
09:00 - 10:00 1.00| SUR 1 RUN TELEDRIFT AND WIRE LINE SURVEY.
TELEDRIFT=1.8 WIRELINE1.9
10:00 - 13:30 3.50| DRL 1 DRILL FROM 6229 TO 6548, 319 FT.=91.1 FPH.
13:30 - 14:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
14:00 - 06:00 16.00| DRL 1 DRILL FROM 6548 TO 7230. 682 FT = 42,62 FT/HR
240 GPM, 125 RPM, 5-6 K ON BIT, .26 RPG MUD MOTOR
12/20/2010 |06:00 - 06:00 24.00| DRL 1 DRILL FROM 7230 TO 7550.320 FT.=13.3 FT./HR
240 GPM, 125 RPM, 5-6 K ON BIT, .26 RPM MUD MOTOR
12/21/2010 | 06:00 - 09:30 3.50| DRL 1 DRILL FROM 7550 TO 7628. 78 FT.=22.3 FT./HR.
240 GPM, 6-7 KON BIT, 125 RPM, .26 GPR MUD MOTOR
09:30 - 10:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
10:00 - 04:00 18.00 | DRL 1 DRILL FROM 7628 TO 8110. 482 FT. =241 FT./HR
240 GPM, 7-10 K ON BIT, 125 RPM, .26 RPM MUD MOTOR

04:00 - 06:00 2.00| SUR 1 CONNECTIONS AND SURVEYS
12/22/2010  |06:00 - 08:00 2.00| DRL 1 DRILL FROM 8110 TO 8136. 26 FT. =13 FT./HR
08:00 - 08:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
08:30 - 19:00 10.50| DRL 1 DRILL FROM 8136 TO 8479. = 343 FT. 32.7 FT/HR
19:00 - 01:30 6.50| TRP 2 PUMP PILL AND TRIP TO PICK UP 1.5 BENT MOTOR AND MWD.
STRAP DRILL PIPE AND BHA. BOARD = 8455.85. STRAP 8483.21

01:30 - 03:00 1.50| TRP 1 LAY DOWN IBS, NMDC, TELEDRIFT, STRAIGHT MOTOR, AND BIT.
WORK BLIND RAMS WHEN OUT OF HOLE.
03:00 - 04:00 1.00| TRP 1 PICK UP BHA # 2 , BIT, BENT MOTOR, UBHO, AND LARGER | D NMDC,
AND ORIENT TOOLS.
04:00 - 06:00 2.00| TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE W/ BENT MOTOR AND MWD.
12/23/2010 | 06:00 - 10:00 4.00| TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE W/ BENT MOTOR AND MWD
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RWU 44-14B (84)
14-7-S 23-E 26
Rig Name: AZTEC

Location:

Spud Date:  6/9/1958
Rig Release: 12/27/2010
Rig Number: 777

Date From - To | Hours | -Code Csoudbe Description of Operations
12/23/2010  |10:00 - 17:30 750|DRL |2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 8479 TO 8725. 246 FT.=32.8 FT/HR.
240 GPM. 10-12 K WT.ON BIT, .26 GPM WITH A 1.5 DEG. BENT MOTOR
125 TOTAL RPM., 44 VIS., 9.2 MUD WT.
17:30 - 18:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE .
18:00 - 04:30 10.50|DRL |2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 8725 TO 9400. 675 FT.= 64.3 FT./HR
04:30 - 06:00 1.50{SUR 1 SURVEYS AND CONNECTIONS
12/24/2010  |06:00 - 15:30 950/ DRL |2 DRILL FROM 9400 TO 9874. 474 FT. = 49.9 FT./HR
240 GPM, 115 RPM, 12-14 K ON BIT, .26 GPR W/ 1.5 BEND MOTOR
15:30 - 16:00 0.50|RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:00 - 04:00 12.00|DRL |2 DRILL FROM 9874 TO 10,475. 601 FT. = 42.9 FT./HR.
04:00 - 06:00 2.00{SUR |1 SURVEYS AND CONNECTIONS
12/25/2010  |06:00-17:00 | 11.00|DRL |2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 10475 TO 10826. 351FT.=31.9 FT./HR.
17:00 - 17:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
17:30 - 19:00 1.50|DRL |2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 10826 TO 10862. 36 FT.=24 FT/HR TD
19:00 - 20:30 1.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE AND CINDITION HOLE FOR SHORT TRIP
20:30 - 00:00 3.50| TRP 14 TRIP QUT TO SHOE
00:00 - 03:00 3.00| TRP 14 TRIP IN AND SAFETY REAM LAST 60 FT..
03:00 - 05:00 2.00{CIRC |1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE
05:00 - 06:00 1.00{ TRP {2 TRIP OUT FOR LOGGING TOOLS @ 9700'
12/26/2010 | 06:00 - 12:30 6.50| TRP |2 TRIP OUT FOR LOGS
12:30 - 13:00 0.50| TRP 1 LAY DOWN DC'S, MONEL, UBHO, MOTOR, AND JARS
13:00 - 13:30 0.50| TRP 1 LOAD OUT DIRECTIONAL TOOLS
13:30 - 15:00 1.50| TRP 1 PRSM, PICK UP E PIPE AND SHUTTLE LOG.
15:00 - 23:30 850/ TRP |2 TRIP IN WITH SHUTTLE LOG
23:30 - 00:00 0.50|CIRC |1 WASH DOWN 20 FT. AND CIRCULATE HOLE
00:00 - 01:30 1.50|CIRC |1 DEPLOY SHUTTLE TOOL AND CIRCULATE
01:30 - 06:00 450|TRP |2 TRIP OUT WITH SHUTTLE LOG
12/27/2010  |06:00 - 09:30 3.50|LOG |1 TRIP OUT WITH SHUTTLE TOOLS
09:30 - 10:30 1.00{LOG |1 LAY DOWN GARAGE PIPE AND LOGGING TOOLS
10:30 - 11:00 0.50| OTH PULL WEAR BUSHING
11:00 - 13:00 2.00/CSG |1 PJSM, CHANGE OUT BAILS AND RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE AND CASING
CREW
13:00 - 14:00 1.00/|CSG |2 RUN 4.5" CASING
14:00 - 15:00 1.00{CSG |2 REPAIR CASING TONG HYDRAULIC UNIT
15:00 - 23:00 8.00{CSG |2 RUN 4.5" CASING
23:00 - 23:30 0.50| OTH CHANGE OUT CASING TONGS
23:30 - 02:00 2.50| REAM |1 REGAIN CIRCULATION AND WASH FROM 9900-9985. HOLE TOOK 225 BBLS
02:00 - 03:00 1.00/{CSG |2 RUN 4.5 CASING
03:00 - 06:00 3.00[CIRC |1 WASH 40 FT TO BOTTOM AND CIRCULATE FOR CEMENT, HOLE TOOK 60
BBLS
12/28/2010  |06:00 - 08:00 2.00{CIRC |1 CIRCULATE CASING
08:00 - 11:30 3.50{CMT |2 PJSM, RU CEMENTERS, TEST LINES TO 5000 PSI,
CEMENT 4.5 CASING, PLUGS BUMPED, FLOATS HELD
11:30 - 15:00 3.50/BOP |1 NIPPLE DOWN BOP, FLOW LINE,CHOKE MANIFOLD,
SET SLIPS WITH 125 K
15:00 - 23:00 8.00|TRP |3 LAY DOWN, HWDP AND DRILL PIPE OUT OF DERRICK
23:00 - 06:00 7.00(LOC |4 RIG DOWN RIG. RIG RELEASED AT 23:00. 12/27/2010
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RWU 44-14B (84)

Spud Date:  6/9/1958

Location: 14-7-S 23-E 26 Rig Release:

Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 3
Date From'- To | Hours:| Code CS:dbe Description of Operations

2/4/2011 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| STIM 3 TIGHT HOLE - Perforate & Frac Mesa Verde Intervals

NOTE: A gauge ring run & CBL/VDL/GR log were ran on this well on 1/4/11 w/
Lone Wolf WL f/ tag @ 10820' to 3400' w/ TOC est @ 4500'. The log was
correlated to the Weatherford Density log dated 12/26/10. The csg & frac head
assembly were tested to 7000# after logging.

All perforating will be done using a 3-1/8" csg gun & 120* phasing per the CBL log
dated 1/4/11. All fracs are using a 2% KCL slick water system using 30/50 mesh
sand & performed by Halliburton. All wirelline by Lone Wolf WL. All frac plugs are
Halliburton Obsidian plugs - all flow thru. All frac work performed on 2/3/11.

On 2/3/11 Perforate Zone #1 interval 10666-74' & 10748-56' @ 3 JPF & 120*
phasing (48 holes).

Zone #1 MV (10666-10756"): Frac this zone w/ 800 gals of 15% HCL followed by a
10300 pad & stage 0.25 to 1.25 ppg sand in 49,000 gals of fluid w/ 2-5000 gal
spacers & flush w/ 800 gals of 15% HCL & 6200 gals of water. Total of 40,700# of
sand & a total load of 1750 bbls. Max rate = 54 BPM; avg rate = 53.5 BPM; Max psi
= 5871#; avg psi = 4470#; (.66). Lubricate in a comp frac plug & set @ 10630'.
Perforate per the above log & gun MV intervals 10304-10'; 10408-14' & 10428-32".
Zone #2 MV (10304-10432"): Frac this interval w/ a 10,000 gal pad & stage 0.25
ppg sand in 77,000 gals of fluid & flush w/ 800 gals of 15% HCL acid & 6360 gals of
water. Total of 63,700# of sand & a total load of 2500 bbls. Max rate = 55 BPM;
avg rate = 54.9 BPM; Max psi = 4709#; avg psi = 4575#; ISIP = 2782# (.71).
Lubricate in a comp frac plug & set @ 10250'. Perforate MV intervals 10164-68' &
10172-76' (24 holes). RDMO Lone Wolf.

Zone #3 MV (10164-10176": Frac this zone w/ a 17000 gal pad & stage 0.25 to
1.25 ppg sand in 32,000 gals of fluid & flush w/ 8430 gals of water. No spacers.
Total of 31,300# of sand & a total of 1160 bbls. Max rate = 46.5 BPM; avg rate =
46.2 BPM; Max psi = 6100#; avg psi = 5380#; ISIP = 5647# (0.99). RDMO
Halliburton. Open the well on a 14/64" @ 5:00 PM on 2/3/11 on a 14/64" choke w/ a
SICP = 2800#. Continue to flow the well on a 14/64" choke overnight & @ 5:30 AM
on 2/4/11 the well is flowing to the pit @ an est rate of 100 BPH w/ no sand & a
show of gas w/ an est recovery in the last 12-1/2 hours of 1200 bbls. Continue to
flow to the pit to clean up.

Flowing CP @ 5:30 AM on 2/4/11 was 900# on a 14/64" choke.

Update: Cont. to flow the well until 5:00 PM & at that time turn well over to
production department w/ FCP = 500# on a 14/64" choke w/ 60 BPH - total cum =
2160 bbls.

Report discontinued until further activity.
Comp Frac Plugs @ 10630' & 10250'

Csg Size: 4-1/2", 11.6#, HCP-110
Csg Depth: 10863’

LLTR: 4400 BBLS

PERFS

Zone #1 - MV

10666-74"; 10748-56'

Zone #2 - MV

10304-10'"; 10408-14"; 10428-32'
Zone #3 - MV

10164-68'; 10172-76'

Printed: 3/15/2011 1:52:24 PM




%

' QEPENERGY

Page 2 of 2

Operations Summary Report
Well Name: RWU 44-14B (84) Spud Date:  6/9/1958
Location:  14-7-S 23-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 3
Date From - To | Hours | Code CSoudbe Description of Operations -
2/412011 06:00 - 16:00 | 10.00|STIM |3
2/28/2011  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 2/28/11: TRAVEL TO LOCATION.
07:00 - 10:00 3.00|LOC |4 SURE UP AROUND WELLHEAD. MIRU.
10:00 - 12:00 2.00| OTH CHANGE EQUIPMENT OVER FOR 2 3/8" TBG. INSTALL NEW BLIND RAMS IN
BOP'S. READY TO SET KILL PLUG IN AM.
12:00 - 13:30 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO TOWN.
3/11/2011 05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 3/1/11: TRAVEL TO LOCATION.
07:00 - 09:00 2.00|LOG |4 FCP= 400# PSL.
RU LONEWOLF WIRELINE. SET 4 1/2" KILL PLUG@ 3221". RD WIRELINE.
09:00 - 09:30 0.50{wWeCL |2 BLOW WELL DOWN TO 0- PRESSURE WITH NO FLUID RECOVERY.
09:30 - 10:30 1.00|BOP |1 ND FRAC VALVE. NU BOP'S. RU TBG EQUIPMENT AND RIG FLOOR. NU
FLOWBACK MANIFOLD.
10:30 - 12:00 150/ TRP |5 TALLY, RABBIT AND RIH WITH 3 5/8" HURRICANE MILL, PO BIT SUB WITH
DOUBLE STRING FLOAT, 1-JT 2 3/8" TBG, 1.81 F-NIPPLE AND 97-JT'S 2 3/8"
TBG.
12:00 - 12:45 0.75{SEQ |1 RU POWER SWIVEL AND CIRCULATING EQUIPMENT.
12:45 - 13:15 0.50 WOT |4 WAITING ON X-OVER FOR POWER SWIVEL.
13:15 - 14:00 0.75|DRL |5 LOAD HOLE WITH 30-BBLS 2% KCL. SWIVEL IN WITH 1-JT. TAG KILL PLUG @
3221'. DRILL UP IN 15-MINUTES. TOOK A 700# PRESSURE KICK. BLED OFF
TO 0-PRESSURE.
14:00 - 14:15 0.25|SEQ |1 HUNG POWER SWIVEL IN DERRICK.
14:15 - 17:00 275|TRP |5 CONTINUED RIH WITH 102-JT'S TBG. EOT@ 6510'. WELL WAS NOT FLOWING.
SWIFN. DRAIN UP PUMP, LINES AND MANIFOLD.
17:00 - 18:30 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO TOWN.
3/2/2011 05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 3/2/11: TRAVEL TO LOCATION.
07:00 - 07:15 0.25| OTH CHECK PRESSURE: SICP= 19004# PSI. SITP= LITE VAC. HOOK UP FLOWBACK
MANIFOLD.
07:15 - 08:15 1.00|wecL |2 OPEN WELL ON 24/64 CHOKE. BLOW PRESSURE DOWN TO 450# PSL.
08:15 - 11:15 3.00|TRP |5 CONTINUE TO TALLY, RABBIT AND RIH WITH 117-JT'S TBG. TAG FRAC
PLUG@ 10,250"
11:15 - 11:45 050, SEQ |1 PU POWER SWIVEL.
11:45 - 12:00 0.25|DRL |5 KICK PUMP IN @ 1/2-BPM WITH 50# CSG PRESSURE FULL/OPEN. DRILL
PLUG UP IN 15-MINUTES.
12:00 - 12:15 025/SEQ |1 HANG POWER SWIVEL IN DERRICK.
12:15 - 12:30 0.25|TRP |5 RIH WITH 12-JT'S TBG.
12:30 - 12:45 0.25/SEQ |1 PU POWER SWIVEL.
12:45 - 13:15 0.50{|DRL |5 KICKED PUMP IN@ 1/2-BPM WITH 50# CSG PRESSURE. TAG FRAC PLUG@
10,630". DRILLED UP IN 15-MINUTES. SWIVEL IN WITH 5-JT'S. TAG PBTD@
10,790".
13:15 - 13:30 0.25/SEQ |1 RD AND RACK OUT POWER SWIVEL.
13:30 - 14:00 0.50| TRP |5 LD 21-JT'S TBG. MU 7" 10K BOWL HANGER. LANDED TBG WITH F-N @ 10,059'
AND EOT@ 10,093".
14:00 - 15:30 1.50| BOP |1 RD TBG EQUIPMENT. ND BOP'S. DROP BALL. NU WELLHEAD. PUMPED BIT
OFF WITH 60-BBLS 25 KCL AND 0-PRESSURE. NU WELLHEAD. SWI.
15:30 - 16:30 1.00| OTH DRAIN PUMP AND LINES. CLEAN UP AND RACK OUT TBG EQUIPMENT.
SDFN.
16:30 - 18:00 1.50| TRAV |1 TRAVEL TO TOWN.
3/3/2011 05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 3/3/11: TRAVEL TO LOCATION.
07:00 - 07:15 0.25|OTH CHECK PRESSURE: SICP= 2275# PSI. SITP= 1750# PSI. ;
07:15 - 12:00 475(LOC |4 RACK OUT REMAINING EQUIPMENT. RIG DOWN. CHAIN UP RIG. WAIT ON
GRADER TO PULL RIG OFF LOCATION. MOVE OUT.  FINAL REPORT.
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