FILE NOTATIONS

Entered tn NID Filo Checked by Ciidt

"Entered On S R Sheef Cony N1O o Fild Office
Location Map Pinsed e o3 e Appr;v;, Lotter
Bard 1at-vad v o7 e B3 mproval Lotter
IV RA Tratnar Bog land o oL e
7 RITTON DaTA .
Dt WA Campl' t | L=BB 3 4./;. Lpcailan Inspected B
W NE e T $oad rolsand
W . o TS P Sate of Foo Lond e
LOGS FILED
Dellor's LR E s rinnranes
Elactric Logs (No. ).........2, .......
E Nl B 2 W -7 ¥\ Micrcu..lﬂ::
Lot ~Mi-L ﬁgni;:.._nm.......... Others
(, 2/
w
FILE NOTATIONS /
Entered in N1D File —— Checked by Clief S
Entered On S R Sheet e armeeareas. Copy NID +o Field Office . ..
Location Map Pinned S Approval Letter
Card Indexed e e enermes Disapproval Letter SN
I'W R for Stste or Fee Land ...
COMPLETION DATA:
Date Well Completed &M Location Inspected ——rae
ow_. kL ww, TA. Bond released
W os FA State of Fee Land P
LOGS FILED

Driler’s Log. 2= K0

Electric Logs {No. .
E ) El GR GRN Miera_
Lat Mi-L Sonic_ Others




Scout Report sent out

Noted i the NID, Fils

Lacation m&p pinned

Approval or Dusapproval Leter
Qm.e_..eda P & A ot

\operahons suspen&d

Pin changed on f?caflon map
Affidavit and Record of A & P
Water ShuthOH Test

Gos Ol Rato Test

Wall Log Filed

DEELVEDUBD



(SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE)

e : UNITED STATES B L
1 - DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR U
GEOLOGICAL SURVEY CE; ’
Vv,
i ORICINAL FORWARDED TO CASPER RE &5

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON ELSEB3()1953

™

........................ SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ABANDONMENT.
................... SUPPLEMENTARY WELL HISTORY.

.......................

(INDICATE ABOVE BY CHECK MARK NATUREK OF REPORT, NOTICE, OR OTHER DATA)

B s locau:d]’aaa‘5 ft. from_. ﬁline and 1923.8; from {%{line of sec. Y
_______ . m R -
8eec. and Bec. No.) (Twp.) . (Range) (Meridian)
________________ Wotah = Tah
(Field) (County or Subdivision) (State or Territory)

DETAILS OF WORK

. : Stat of and ted depths to objective sands; show sizes, weights,'and lengths of casings; indicate mudding jobs, cement-
g ¢ * . ing polnh,' and all other important pr:‘poud work; ne

IthmmaedtodrnlaMforoﬂforc@lmumhuumr“ﬁn.
Proposed casing program is:

16-3/4* 40,5 0D surface sasing at approximetely k80!, cemented te swrface
™ oD 23§ J-ssmmwommnmatm', sstimated depth,
with suificient cement to exclude all potential or gaz scnes.

;‘::‘- Bstimated Top Oreen River @ 3030¢ (2772+)
Estimated Top Wasateh = 5862 (.60¢)

(APPROVAL IS CONDITIONAL UPON COMPLIANCE WITH THE TERMS ATTACHED HERETO)

1 understand that this plan of work must receive approval in writing by the Geological Survey before

P 1 may be d

Company . The Califernis Cempeay === .
Address P, 0, Bex 4SS

_Vernal, Gten == By .. . Fo Lo M

Title Fleld Sunt

e o < . PR
YT TV POPSNIUAL SRR TR E SIT IR | Wy R N 2ot T P S I N e 3% e

IR Y. <X A



Budget Bureau 42-R358.2,
Approval expires 12-31-52.
Form 9-331a
(Feb. 1951)

(SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE)

UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

: g m e com e
i
'

. > B GEOLOGICAL SURVEY
P ) 10Ty
Y} LA N
ORiCIiL FoRvAnDED TO Cavred
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON ELI:S RNTRENG.
oo S
. U B |-~
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO DRILL o oooooe oeoeercmmmen oo || sUBSEQUENT REPORT OF WATER SHUT-OFF__.. SEC T
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO CHANGE PLANS_ ... —eeoocemee|oiee SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING. _.__ . ——-oc-femmen
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO TEST WATER SHUT-OFF__________|_._.|| SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ALTERING CASING. . . ---icoouosocmociooon
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO RE-DRILL OR REPAIR WELL| SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF RE-DRILLING OR REPAIR._ ... )
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO SHOOT OR ACIDIZE. .__._.......____. I SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ABANDONMENT....__... — —-oooorooemoloneo
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO PULL OR ALTER CASING......| || SUPPLEMENTARY WELL HISTORY____ o oo g
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO ABANDON WELL . ... I Beopord m”l‘ X
i [

B A B

(Twp.) (Range) .
Tt Fieldy e Gounty or Subdivisiony (State or Territory),

The elevation W above sea level is $TSh.8 ft. BB (Zeve)
DETAILS OF WORK

(State names of and expected depths to objective sands; show sizes, weights,’'and lengths of p casings; indicate mudding jobs, coment-
ing points, and all other important proposed work,

wu:u.mmm-wmmaxmm&.aﬁ,m.aﬁs“u
ummm—uu‘uammu—xum 8% 0al.
Heweo prooess top and bobbem. Ouide shes snd fleat seller 2 Jte. (63.56°) spert.
Ran twe Heweo centralisers st hO3' and 302°, ,

1 understand that this plan of work must receive approval in writing by the Geological Survey before operations may be commenced.

Company .. The Callfwrnia Company : o
Address . Pe Oe Box {55




Budget Bureau 42-R358.3.
Approval expires 12-31-65.

ol o 8alt Lake City
—T (SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE) LondOfcs o OBY
UNITED STATES “™ Sod Wash
4B DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR "™~ =& ~
- GEOLOGICAL SURVEY '
: ' ORIGINAL FORWARDED TO CASPER

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON

& sas et QA
443 - R\

L JlOC‘CAL sV 42X PY\
D ECTTY . Y

NOTICE OF INTENTION TOORILL. ... ... _. .. __.._._.. .  SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF WATER SHUT-OFF._____.. B .
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO CHANGE PLANS . L . : SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING.. ..

NOTICE OF INTERTION TO TEST WATER SHUT-OFF .. - .t SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ALTERING CASING .. .. .

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO RE-DRILL OR REPAIR WELL _. * SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF RE-DRILLING OR REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO SHOOT OR ACIDIZE A . SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ABANDONMENT __....

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO ABANDON WELL

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO PULL OR ALTER CASING. o ! mm#me_ﬁ m,n o . I

{INDICATE ABOVE BY CHECK MARK NATURE OF REPCRT, NOTICE, OR OTHER DATA)

Vernal, Utah ) Rmﬂ:nl? 19 53

Well No. . 30 . is located 1,888'5 ft. from . ‘lS ' line and 1,923’8&. from iWJ' line of sec. 13 )
NE} SW} Sec 13 75 23 SLBM |
T Sac, and Sec. No.) . T (Twp) U7 (Rangey T T (Meri :
Red Wash Uintah Ttah
’ . (Fleld) : i (County or Subdivisiony {3tate or Terrtory)

The elevation géﬁ%m above sea level iSS?&‘.'6 fr. KB (Zero)
DETAILS OF WORK

(State namos of and expected depths to objective sands; show sizes, weights, and lengths of proposed casings; indicate mudding jobs, cement-
ing points, and all other important proposed worlSo

g Ran DST #1 at 5820-48!', Howeo packer set at 5320'. No BHC, no W.C. Tool opened with

; weak blow, steadily decreasing to dead in 29 minutes., Left tool for 15 minutes more then
flushed and re-opened at 2:50 AM. !ad weak blow for 10 minutes gradually increasing to
fair and stayed throughout. Yo gas to surface, no surface pressure. Recovered 70' of
very slightly eil cut mud. .

IF §FF  SI P . mH
BT 62 &2 162 2940
FRD 200 150 ° 2Lo 3050

! undersiand that this plan of wurk must receive approval in writing by the Geological Survey before operations may be commenced.

The California Company

Cﬂmpam
Address . P. 2. lax 455
Vernal, !itah , B, F.L. ».ﬂRRyJ,/W
NOV 2 1957 | o
Bpproved i e . O oasswn. ‘
(Oric. tad) W, . Scevile . /‘,.' -

Dipsrs



Budget Buresu 42-R363. 3.
Approval expires 12-31-56.

Form 9-331a
(Feb. 1951)

(SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE)

UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
GEOLOGICAL SURVEY

ORIGINAL FORWARDED T0 CASPER
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO DRILL. . iceemammimmmmmmmm e o ii SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF WATER SHUT-OFF . ... —o o -
e NOTICE OF INTENTION TO CHANGE PLANS._ . [T " . l SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING.. _4‘ -
‘*c” 1 NOTICE OF INTENTION TO TEST WATER SHUT-OFF. ... . o K SUBS‘EQUENT REPORT OF ALTERING CASING. ... e e e
. NOTICE OF INTENTION TO RE-DRILL OR REPAIR WELL._. . SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF RE-DRILLING OR REPAIR ._ e
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO SHOOT OR ACIDIZE . 5UBSEQUENT REPORT OF ABANDONMENT. _-. .- - R
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO PULL OR ALTER CASING PPLEMENTARY WELL HISTORY ... - e g
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO ABANDON WELL. . ? mwn HM“.N,R x

(INDICATE ABOVE BY CHECK MARK NATURE OF REPORT, NOTICE, OR OTHER OATA)

Vernal, tan  Novesber 19 19 53

. N Fs _' )
Well No. - . 30 islocated 186345 ft. from . &S@Y line and 1923'a{t from;g; line of sec. . 1
L)Lnﬂ \A/

Ns* Sk} sec 17 B’ ‘238 o
04 Se_c an 1 Sec. No ) Twp.) (Ranl..e) (M cidink)
Red ash tiintah , , vah
A—\F-iei(.ﬁ" ’ T ) ' \L‘uunty or bubd\vmon) ’\lau w T (:r_rll()r-v)“h- N o

i 6 |
The elevation b R idekrt & ook above sea level 152;' - ft. KB (werol
DETAILS OF WORK

(State names of and expected depths to objective sands; show sizes, weights, and hn'thi of pro sad casings; indicate mudding jobs, cement~
ing points, and all othor important proposed go

. - T T T e IS . g

Tas mm iq a0 e Tt gy o ;ac Y3 e 4, at f”..;\ an 3‘)' e 'P no » o e VSRS

meened 1T CNTS. RN :*r."’ 44 ~manioee Lo Lood Lu D7 .'-Ll.u“o,. “as t\_ gnrface 8
1 utes huracd e o ge k. 0 surfaco poess.rle. _ag volune Luc LuEll WO

sgasare., ecoverwd 1300 vlea. 5il, 90 oil a3 mud cut water, 180* uddy water.

I° P FF P sIP i
Top BT ' 2995 1S 223 1970
diddle BT 2875 1335 335 2000
Bottom FHI 3000 1590 1700 1860
\; ] understand that this ptan of work must receive approval in writing by the Govlogical Survey befors operations may be commenced.
R Company The C&lilornis -umpany. .
Address . Po e Pox “55 . .
| Vernal, Gtan By _ Fe Le mmx/Wf
2 1437 3
NCY = Title  Fielo S@pbe .

mro"d-w“-v-mww. NN

s

/- ,
7/4 ZC L panmenc BrNTING DIFIEE 10 -S437-b

(orig, ), LR C. Seovile L =
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Budget Bureau 42-R358.3.

Fo 9-381 Approval expires 12-31-85.
N Land Omee S81% Lake City
] (SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE) 7 1‘ """""""
""" s UNITED STATES Loase No. o o
----- 0o DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ™7
R -0 N GEOLOGICAL SURVEY

ORIGINAL FORWARDED

: IL . -
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON W -
HiE Gt Y
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO DRILL. . o e eeee ‘ ______ SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF WATER SHUT-OFF ... o e l _____
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO CHANGE PLANS ____ oo SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING. . ... . .,-__.%w__;
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO TEST WATER SHUT-OFF_______ ... SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ALTERING CASING __ .. - [P P

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO RE-DRILL OR REPAIR WELL......._. SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF RE-DRILLING OR REPAIR. ..........cooo’ovoon
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ... ....-wc---- SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ABANDONMENT ___... ... ---o-ooonoe- S
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO PULL OR ALTER CASING._...__ .....ooi------ SUPPLEMENTARY WELL HISTORY ................................ -

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO ABANDON WELL... ... . ... . Subsequent Report of DOY K2 X

_Vernal, Utah . Novemhar 3. . , 1953,

Well No. .30 is located _lﬁﬁﬁgﬁt..from__){gx} line and 1923 ,8t. fron'm line of sec. 13

NER W3 Sec 13 . | 235 o SLBY

[¢71 - and Seo. No.) (Twp.) (Range) " (Meridian)

______________ Red .esh . ... _Uitgh ... .o Ul
” (Fleld) (County or Bubdivision) (State or Territory)

The elevatxonm above sea level is 578L46 ft. ¥B (Zerod
DETAILS OF WORK

(State r of and expected depths to obkcuv. sands; show sizes, weights, and lengths of pro casings; indicate mudding jobs, coment~
ing points, and all other important pro work .

Ran DIST #3 5704=-24', Howeo packers set at 5TOL' and 5692¢, Wo BHC, no W.C. uoul
opened 90 min. ©I 30 min. Veak blow increasing to good in 10 min. Gs&e to surface
in UO min. Purned with orouge flane. Surface pressure § psi thru {8 vulve. Volume
too small to meseure. Hecoverad 960! clesn oil and 150' mud and oil eut water,

IrP FFP 31 °p Hd

Top BT 209 270 xyEMATRS 2875
Middle BT 220 k0 1865 2540
Bottom F:D . 2680 2500 2500 3000

I understand that this plan of work must receive approval in writing by the Goological Survey before operations may be commenced.

Company .... _ The Calidfornia Co. .

Address . Ps O Box U35

 Vernal, Utsh. By . Fala mu’/t/ _________________
NOV 24 1953 ‘ ‘
Approved .__........- Title . Yield Supt,

C. Soeville
('“" s") “' . / . §. COVERNMENT PRINTING OFFICE 16~8437-%
Du; nct Eumnoet




Form 9-881a
(Feb. 1961)

(SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE)

UNITED STATES
_____ DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
: GEOLOGICAL SURVEY

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

v | NOTICE OF INTENTION TO DRILL.____omomooomeoococemimeceoe SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF WATER SHUT-OFF ... _._.._._. .oooficee
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO CHANGE PLANS. ...l SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING__ .. oo
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO TEST WATER SHUT-OFF__.__.__..__|..._. SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ALTERING CASING. ... oooiooooenmobenees
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO RE-DRILL OR REPAIR WELL. .. ... ||l suBSEQUENT REPORT OF RE-DRILLING OR REPAIR .. ...
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ________ooorom- t ______ SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ABANDONMENT. ... ... oooeocelocaes
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO PULL OR ALTER CASING. . .....___._. ||| SUPPLEMENTARY WELL HISTORY._..o.oooooooooooooommomommmmaecf oo
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO ABANDON WELL. ... . . b e o o i RO

The elevation of the derrick floor above sea level is ... ft.
DETAILS OF WORK

Stat. of and expected deptha to objecti sands; show sises, weights, and lengths of pr casings; indicate mudding jobs, cement-
¢ o names ot ance P »ln':polnts: :nd all otb'or lu‘:por'tnnt proposed work, ! i *
Page 2 of 2

oruds followed by 5 bbla. #5 Furner fusl, FPressures 3800¢ to 22004#. Puaped 2h whle,
#S Burner fusl mixed with 1# sand/gal. Inj. rate 4.0 bbls/min. Pressure 26004.
Flushed sandeoil away with 30 bbls. Rangely crude. Pressure 2200f.

I understand that this plan of work must receive approval in writing by the Geological Survey before operations may be commeneesd.

COMPANY o o o
’ Address ... o
SOV By o
....................................................................... Title .o

V- 5. GOVENNMENT PRINTING OPFICE 16—847-3




Budget Burean ¢3-R358.3.
) o Approvel expires 13-81-85. ¢
porz »-ssta oare_SalS_ Lake QI8Y
— (SUBMIT IN-FRIPLICATE) La..d Offiee - - -
i e T Lease No, .. WY& ... - |
--------------- UNITED STATES
i U -
----- DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR '™
X GEOLOGICAL SURVEY ’
g =, ORIGIZAL TCH./ARDED TG CASPER
) 7 ~L
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON W l\.S.F | Y
K NOTICE OF INTENTION TO DRILL . i v 1 SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF WATER SHUT-OFF .. oo oiimmmneemen
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO CHANGE PLANS . o memea)oame- SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING . ... oe|-oenn
;'_7' NOTICE OF INTENTION TO TEST WATER SHUT-OFF . ___ el SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ALTERING CASING. ... . ocomeeemommanlmmme o
E NOTICE OF INTENTION TO RE-DRILL OR REPAIR WELL . _______.{------ SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF RE-DRILLING OR REPAIR. . o] “
L NOTICE OF INTENTION TO SHOOT OR ACIDIZE .. eecleeaen SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ABANDONMENT ___ . cceoomemmmonn|meme
— NOTICE OF INTENTION TO PULL OR ALTER CASING_ .- oj-om- SUPPLEMENTARY WELL HISTORY oo ooooemoommmmammommmmmenfaees B
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO ABANDON WELL ... .. MQMM#Mﬁ D & ;
_______________________________________________________________ | U U P PSP bt e
(INDICATE ABOVE BY CHECK MARK NATURE OF REPORT, NOTICEK, OR OTHER DATA)
Yernal, Ttah . Jevaw. 8 , 195k
Well No. 30, is located 18885 ft. from._. {‘S‘} line and 192381t from @} line of sec. .13 .
NBg SWi Bee, 13 ) - S '3 ) S siaM .
(3 Sec. and Sec. No.) (Twp.) (Range) (Meridian) .
o Bed Wesn I /3 7 ¥ U — Utah ;
(Field) (County or Bubdivision) (8tate or Territory)

The elevation wicabosdemisis i above sca level 567846 ft. XB (Zero)
DETAILS OF WORK

Stat. of and expected depths to objective sands; show sizes, weights, and lengths of pro casings; indieate mudding jobs, cement~
( * ing points, and all otl\'or important proposed work; ne

" Ren 78T #4 to test perforiuen §747-5752¢, Set Howco Hookewall packer at 57h3. No BHG,
mo ¥.C. Tool opened with good blow decreasing to nothing in 9 hws. Rigged up and swabbed.

T A % SO T T MR W

¥o. of Runs Yluid level Sweb Depth o1l Cut
S 2400 - 3500 3400 -« 5400 3 bbls. | 1.k water
é 3500 « 5300 5400 13 bbla, 1158 water

Pulled tool loooé, recovered 32k0! of clean oil and L5' of water., No pressures en
Fpessure bonbe due to swebhing.

1 understand that this plan of work must receive approval in writing by the Geological Survey befors operati may be

Company .. .. T8 CAMALORNAA. COMPMAY.......... o oo oo

Address ... . Po Oo Bex bS5 .
........................ Vernal, Utab . By ram/??
.App.mﬂed-..‘y.\y.ln oM | Title ... Hald -Ma .....

_(_g{;;’_‘m.l '_“_-‘ _c_-_iﬁi‘“_l? ''''' = g U. 5. GOVERNMENT PRINTING OPPICE  16~—8437-8
District Enainesr

e r————t o ———n

r o e e ——an i A te ML e swnr T



Budget Bureau 42-R356.3.
Approval expires 12-31-68.

Form 9-381a
(Feb. 1961) . o
(SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE) rd Omce 5010 Lake CLYY

<4 1% E Lease No. ._‘m ..............
e ot | UNITED STATES

- DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR "™ > CEIVE

_____ g ML GEOLOGICAL SURVEY /e &5

ORIGINAL FOR\VARDED TO GASPER”

JAN1119%4

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON

4

. L £ =y
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO DRILL. ... ..o ooooomnn ' ______ SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF WATER suur-orr&é.—;—.:&..:hi..
; NOTICE OF INTENTION TO CHANGE PLANS ___|| sSUBSEQUENT REPORT OF SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING.........ocer|-oen
[ NOTICE OF INTENTION TO TEST WATER SHUT-OFF____.__.______ \ ______ SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ALTERING CASING. ... _........|._...]
{ NOTICE OF INTENTION TO RE-DRILL OR REPAIR WELL _______ | ____. SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF RE-DRILLING OR REPAIR __. ___ _______|___.
. NOTICE OF INTENTION TO SHOOT OR ACIDIZE __. . __..._..... Lo SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ABANDONMENT ... __......_...____l__..
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO PULL OR ALTER CASING__..__..___ __ ! ______ SUPPLEMENTARY WELL HISTORY . ____ el
: NOTICE OF INTENTION TO ABANDON WELL. . o e e
Noticeef Intention to Complete X . ... .. . ... Lo
i; (INDICATE ABOVE BY CHECK MARKv NATURE OF REPORT, NOTICE, OR OTHER DATA)

¢

S, Vernal, Utah  Janwary 7. , 195
.

Well No. 30 is locatedl88845. ft. from.. g} line and 1923.4 ft. from g/} line of sec. . 8§ 13

WB} S%iSes. )Y m 3 ) S e OB
[£71 . and Sec. No.) (Twp.) (Range) (Meridian)
"""""""""" Feldy T T T (Gounty or Subdivision) T (Btate or Territory)

The elevationfcieoxiuexieks@iooe above sca level iSI0h.A._ ft. XB (Zereo)
DETAILS OF WORK

State of and expected ths to objecti nds; sho , weights, and lengths of pr Mun indisate mudding jebe, semend-
¢ dep ln:.p.:inni andw other ll=po:unt proposed wuk; ! e

After well ia drilled and cored to 5850', Schlumberger Electric Survey and Nicrelog
will be run. Straddle DST's of mnes of doubtful fluid content will be run., Intend
to run 5850' of 7" 23f and 26§ J=55 & N-8O LT&C Domestic and Yoreign csg and esmentd
with 300 sacks Streta-crete cement mix, follewed by 125 sks. Ideal common eement, After
¥.0.C. 72 hr. cement will be drilled out to 5810 and osg tested with 1500 pei. Gamm~
Ray, Neutron Logs will be run and some of the following intervals will be perfersted with
bullets and 3 jets per ft: 56145618, 56955702, STCL-5712, 57335743, STh1-575%, ST01l-
3, 5787<8797, 57155723, Perforations will be scraped and the perforsted imtervals
will be treated with sandeoil. 24" EUE J-55 will be run and well swabbed before re-

lessing rig.

I understand that this plan of work must receive approval in writing by the Geological Survey before operati may be

Compﬁny . .The California Co.

Address . PeOe Box US55

/\

_Vernal, Utah By ... Ko Lo MERRY / 77 0¥ =

AppraveddAN 1 994 o Title . Field Bupt.

(Orig. Sgh) W O Scoville 5. GOVERNNENT PRINTING OFFICE  J6—8437-8
- P ERERERTEITI IR o ] .
Disiriet Engiveer S 4 : :



9-881a
(Feb. 1051) N

(SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE)

R S B B UNITED STATES

..... DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
X GEOLOGICAL SURVEY

i ORIGIHAL FORWARDED TO CAGPER
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON

JAN1119%4
!“"SSL N

. <yl
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO DRILL . e si I SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF WATER ﬂiUT-WF--.XtMVJ:‘_g-
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO CHANGE PLANS_____ . ______|._.___ SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING _.._ .. ... .. ...
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO TEST WATER SHUT-OFF__._.______ SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ALTERING CASING. ... ... foeee]
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO RE-DRILL OR REPAIR WELL_____ __. ! AAAAAA SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF RE-DRILLING OR REPAIR...._ .. ...

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO SHOOT OR ACIDIZE..___._.._..._. .. l ______ SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ABANDONMENT..__.___._.._ —_._._..
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO PULL OR ALTER CASING__..._ .. __ __ | ...... SUPPLEMENTARY WELL HISTORY ____ . ..
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO ABANDON WELL.. ... I © | Subsequent Raport of Completiom X

(8tate or Territory)

The elevation stisabwaiictiom above sea level is $73k.6 ft. IB (2ere)
DETAILS OF WORK

Stat d bpoctod depths to objective sands; show sizes, weights,-and lengths of pro, casings; indieate mudding jobs, cement-
o i .3 e ® ° ing p.:lnu,; and all other h:pottnnt proposed work; ne
Ran ts, T

mﬁg‘ 264, J=55 8rd thd R-1, LT&C Demestio, 1 j¢. 234, 8rd, R.l LTZC Demsstds,
1719 jts. T M J-55 8rd, R-l STXC Japanese, 37 jts. T® OD 23 J-55, Brd A-) INAO
Younstowms, 1 4. T* OD 23 J-55, 8rd R-1 STLC Japaness, 1 jt. 7'0!3!81!!-80811, R-3 0700
Domestie casing ¢ and cemended with (2.2cu. ft.) Strata-crete cement (LOS
Perlite, W3S eement, kf Gel). PFollowed by ee Tdeal ecmmon sement. Howso preesss,
$op & bottem plugs, Ran Baker fillup shos L up collar 3 jJte. (60.77!) spart. Rem 10
Baker centralisers at SW. 5805. S76% 57253 ;685. 5&5. %. 5605. S » 5525. M M-
AfSer T2 hr, W,0.C, Drilled out 1, Ran NeCullough Oamma~yay and Neutron lLege fwem
3000* to 5810'. Perfora G7k7=5752¢ with 3 jets and Lk bullets per fool, Rmm
PST #h. Perforated intervals S595-570R, 5704=5712, 5733-57h3, 5701-5783 and 5707-5797 with
3 oxXkwtmoonl jets and i bullets per foot. Interval 2) was perforated with 3} jete
and 6 bullets per foot. Set Howeo Wi straddle pasker at 5761-5788 snd sand-oil squessed
the perforated intervals 5781-5783 and 5787-5797 as follews: Squeesed 10 bbt:m/

. ’ ; )

1 underatand that this plan of work must receive approval in writing by the Geoclogical Survey before operations may be com:

Approved JAN l. -l -19“54‘“‘ .................. . Title ... rial M

(Om;. Sgd) H. C. SGO‘V-iE‘:»-” ﬂl- GOVERNNENT PRINTING OPFICE  JE~S4FT-3
- ' ‘ District £ngineer i . . N

e e e o KU PR R P L R ey g




FOLD ‘ MARK

Budget Barean No. 42-R355.2.
Approv fres 12-31-52,

Form 9-380
U. 8. Laxp OFFICE Salt Lake ity

SErIAL NUMBER Wl T

Lgase or Peryit 1o PrOseRCT .. - -

UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INT,

GEOLCGICAL SURVEY

x [P

ORIGINAL FORWARDED TO CASPER

LOCATE WELL CORRECTLY

Company ___ X8 Califernia Cos . Address ... PeQe Box W8S . .
FLessor or Tract . Bad. M_M’t -7 Tield .. Red VWash __ .- State R ' 7\ S
Well No. -..-n_-_/_- Sec. .13-T. 78" R. 238 Meridian 8IBM.—. . County . _Mnotah

LocanMé ft. {‘} of & _ Line an%’2 3'§t E. }of X Line of . 5“5-_].-3 Eh:’:f&?ﬁ},,st?a&‘ét

The information given herewith is a u)molete and correct record of the well and all work done thereon
so far as can be determmed from all available records.
signed . Pe. e MERRY

Date Pekruary b, 39% . . Title

The summary on this page is for the condition of the well at above date.
Commenced drilling . . QobebeX 12 7 1983 .. Finished drilling - . _ Nevember 15 19.83.

OIL OR GAS SANDS OR ZONES
(Denote gas by @)

No. 1, from 8698  to . ¥+ - S A No. 4, from 5713 _to .. } _le
? 5 5 5;,
No. 2, from ____ ... Stoh . to .. Sm__é No. 5, from ... ?"17 Sto ] ,32' L.

No. 3, from _. S8 to. STRY _ﬁa No. 6, from . 3.3’ S ' I gg’j;(&%]’
2

MPQRTANT WATER SANDS
No. 1, from Skl . to. SM " No. 3, from . L to ) w2l
No. 2, from _551_@ t0 ... 5559 .7 No. 4, from = . . . . .- .to.. ...

CASING RECORD

Threads per Make Amount
'.b‘v"!'si"'q%r‘ i ”I:PQ |--- 295D
— By it b "
e w i
£ u’Ein DLYIIG TR &8 A
f,.,sz

- __ R et T atebat il 4;,;;,Ll,“‘u:-—.-«;;’;:;é.’i:’:::’;:."'..;:.'4..;‘::."-‘:—‘:::-' =

MUDDING AND CEMENTING RECORD R4 7 5 L

Slze n I
_easing Where ‘et —!—__ Number sncks of cement ! l(?thod used Mud granty | Amount of mud used
mgaog; FTTy I‘Nhn ~Raddren | — o
i ‘ Q )
,,: 125 sks, Tdeal Gnqa IS N P
, - PLUGS AND ADAPTERS
Heaving plug ~Muaterin] , Length
Adapters-—Materinl _ i ... Dize

§HO0TING RE(,ORD




Rotary tools were used from

Cable tools were used from .

~ Pebruary %

‘ ’
The production for the first 24 hours was .

. e ,
emuision; 3 0, water; und .

7 sediment

1t gas well, cu. ft. per 24 hours

Reck pressure, lbs. per s m

Gy Mo Caver - -

Do Bo Heely. ..
Comew [ w
0 933
933 1325
1325 sk3k
Sh3l 5520
5520 5611

5608
5695

5782
5797

5842

5695

5782

8791
5842

5857

B R |
: N— - e
- .A__.!;. SRR A
. S R U
TOOLS USED_
.
o] feet to ... B8GGF _ feet, and from .. _feet to ._... foet
feet to ... . . feet, and from . feet to . feet
DATES
L1985k ., Put to producing .. Jamary 23.. . 19 sy
' . . '/ A .
0 . barrels of fluid of which ﬂ n wWas o1l Y%

Gravity, °Bé. _R9.7° API

{1allons gasoline per 1,000 cu. ft. of gas .

EMPLOYEES

, Driller

o Dnller

! TOTAL ¥EET

E 933
; 392
i Ll1os
Core #1
Core #2
Core #3

Core #4

Core #5
Core $6

Corm #7

FORMATION RECORD

E. Carpsr . - .- -, Drilier
. Le Thomas - ) . Driller

FORMATION

Sand & Shale L. Green River Correl, Point

Shale Ty Sul6r (£339)

Send & Shale LA G 2t M

Rec, 78! ~ 154¢ 38, 9%' Sltss, 524 Clyst.

Rec. 85%' - L7* 8S, 5¢ Clyst, 254! Siltst, 8¢ Sh.

Rec. 85 - LGkt BS, 108+ Siltet, 24’ Clyst,
3af Coqe

Rec., 79! - 86 88, L' Silst, L' Clyst, 3t Cong.,
2% Coqas

Rec, 9t ~ 9t 58,

Ree. LO' - 2Lk! 85, T¢ Clyst, 34! 8ilst, 21 8b,
2t Coqe, 1° Limestons,

Rec, 15' - 10t 85, 2! Cog, 3' Clyst.



- . S Budget Bureau 42-R358.3.
. Approval expires 12-31-55.

o o
(SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE) Land Ofice 5814 Lake Clty
----------------------- UNITED STATES Lease No. .. R,
33 DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR V- Red-¥esh-—
3 GEOLOGICAL SURVEY

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO DRILL SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF WATER SHUT-OFF

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO CHANGE PLANS SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING.

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO TEST WATER SHUT-OFF. SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ALTERING CASING

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO RE-DRILL OR REPAIR WELL 1{ SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF RE-DRILLING OR REPAIR.

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO SHOOT OR ACIDIZE _____ . }eeoos SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ABANDONMENT ____ ...
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO PULL OR ALTER CASING X SUPPLEMENTARY WELL HISTORY.

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO ABANDON WELL -

B TIE 1T Hovember-3-—— 1 956--
Well No. ... 3¢ is located 1848 45 ft. from__}F}S Tine andjga3,8- ft. from%} line of sec. 33
HE o% 3 1.5 P31 SR
(¥4 Sec. and Bec, No.) (Twp.) (Range) (Meridian)
--------- Pﬁﬁ-z%%ﬁ'i)h----------------- -"giﬁ%a}"‘(()ounty or Subdivision) -"gt’&“;-(state or Territory)

The elevation of the derrick floor above sea level 1552846 ft.
DETAILS OF WORK

(State names of and expecied depths to objective sands; show sizes, weights,-and lengths of proposed casings; indicate mudding jobs, cement-
ing points, and all other important proposed workgo

It is gz_japoaed to pgr{.‘emm additional sands with 3 jets and 3 bullets i foot
Lfrom 5506 « 5002, 5506 « 612, 5615 = 5627 and 5550 - 5652 and zand 0il squeese
to observe the effect of gag injecbtion into R Unit 412,

1 understand that this plan of work must reccive approval in writing by the Geological Survey before operations may be commenced.

Company ... gtendard -013--Company-af-Califormis
Address ... _Ji, &y Bex $85 oo

U. S. GOVERNMENT PRINTING OFFICE 16—8437-5



Budget Bureau No, 42-R358.4.
Approval expires 12-31-60.

(SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE) Land Offics ... “h"

UNITED STATES N - Y

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
..... % o GEOLOGICAL SURVEY

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

NOTICE OF lNTENT!ON TO DRILL - SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF WATER SHUT-OFF

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO CHANGE PLANS ; SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO TEST WATER SHUT-OFF : SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ALTERING CASING
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO RE-DRILL OR REPAIR WELL SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF RE-DRILLING OR REPAIR..
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ___ .. ________ l‘._ SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF ABANDONMENT.

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO PULL OR ALTER CASING SUPPLEMENTARY WELL HISTORY.

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO ABANDON WELL. i i

(INDICATE ABOVE BY CHECK MARK NATURE OF REPORT, NOTICE, OR OTHER DATA)

o L o  19.2a
Well No.”____ is located”t fronf™ lme and mft fro line of sec. “ :

%wﬁo) ~Ag P . )
---““em) ' Mty or Subdivision) ' “ﬂte or Territory)

The elevation of the derrick floor above sea level is _ ft.
DETAILS OF "WORK
(State of and exp d depths to objective sands; show sizes, weights, and lengtlu of pro sed casings; indicate mudding jobs, cement~

.ing points, and all other important proposed work,

1 understand that this plan of work must receive approval in writing by the Geological Survey before operations m.y be commenced.

Company ..

Address — “m‘mew

WA T, Ry i
W e 5 Title B
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STANDARD OIL COMPANY OF CALIFORNIA

FIELD: Red Wash _ PROPERTY: Section 13B ‘
WELL NG.  23-13B (30) Sec., 13 .1 8p23E _SoLog s

Following Is complete und correct record of all work done on the wall sincs the pre\)ious record dated_February b, 195k

PURPOSE OF WORK: Perforate and sand frac additional intervals

DATE OF REPORT: December 31, 1959 BY. Co ¥,

g

WORK DONE 8Y: R & R Well Service

COMMENCED OPERATIONS: February b, 1959 COMPLETED OPERATIONS:  February i, 1959
DATE WELL LAST PRODUCED: February 3, 1959 DATE RETURNED TO PRODUCTION; February 16, .
PRODUCTION: PRIOR TO WORK AFTER WORK
O .« v v e e e e e e AT B . . . 1B B
Weter . o v . e e e e e e . 0 Y, B 32 ___am
BOS v o e e e e e e e 326 M/D . . 16 mes/o
Gravity .« « . e e e e e e e e e 2ot . CAPY . L 2Tl cam
Tobing . .« . o o e e e e e e . 250 PSIG . . . 200 __ psic
Cosing . . . o . o . ol . . 200 PSIG. , .o O PG
Method of Productions Pumping . . . . . . X e b e e —
Flowing . . . . . .
Gosbifr . . . . . . e e e

SUMMARY

T. Do 5850° : Effective Depth: 5810°

Casing: 7" csg. cmid. Sng“b ) i
(Bottom 3 Jts or 657 and top 1 j%t or L* Perforations: g747.5752, 5704 737
is 26 J-55; remainder is 23#.) g’;&é,b’;'?ai-;;83,5§}(g‘f(-g%
.3 jJets and & bullets/ft.
5715-5723 3 jets end 6 bul -
per L£4., 5591=5597, 5640~ B
5652, 5,6.1“"56)"0: 5614-560%
5604=5610 .ahd 5585-5591 . :
& 1/2 bullet holes per fi.




s - : :
Page €

WELL NO: 23-1313 {30) PROPERTY: Secticn 13B RED WASH FIELD
HISTORY

Red Wash well 23-13B {30) was completed in the Green River formation November, 1953 for

an initial production of 135 B/D oil, O B/D water and 26 MCF/D gas. By January 1958

production increased to 158 B/D oil, ¢ B/D water and 326 MCF/D gas.

It is proposed to re-enter well and perforate w/l - 1/2% holes/fte, 55935597, 56L8-5652",
563456401, S6LL=56260, 5504=5610°%, 5585<55917, .

1. Move in workover rig snd £il1l hole with ﬁangely crude.

2. Pull rods.

3, Run tubing paraffin knife on rods to top of PSN.

L, Install) BOPE and pull ‘ubing. Keep nole full while pulling tubing,

5, Run mill shoe on twbing %o 5810¢ %o clean out paraffin.

6. Run Halliburton magnesiun bridge plug on tubing and set at 5680! (K.B, datam).

7o Shoot ki = 1/2% bullet holes/foot from 5591-5597¢ (Gamma-collar log, Shoot from -

collars at 55L8-1/2, 5577, and 5602,

8. Set Baker full bore retainer at 55600 and swab test perfs 5591=97 until diagnostlic
fluid obtained, (If gons isg wel, further program to follow, If zone is clean,
proceed to step 9} '

9, Pull retainer and perforate 56L8-52, 563L=L0, 561L4=26, 550k=10, 5585=-91 (Gamma log
measuremenis. Shoot from following collars: 55L8=1/2, 5577, 5602, 5628, 565kL).

10, Sand oil frac above .pe-r s down Iﬁé casing using 200 bbls burner fuel mixed with
12,6004 20~40 Ottawa sand and LOOF Adomite. Use 120 neoprene-nylon balls in 3 = 4O
ball batches after esch 50 barrels of sand=—cil mix., Displace with 210 bbls of burner

fuel,
11, Backscutile sand & nylon balls with mill shoe o top of bridge piug, ' Pull outte
12, Drill up bridge plug and clean oul Lo botlom,

3

13, Change to tubing liner pump and re-run twbing to original depih. Change to

offset head,
1}, Run rods and place well on preduchion.
WORK TONE
February L, 1959

Moved in and rigged up.  R&R Well Sexrvice.
Displaced well with 250 bbls hot Rangely Crude,



_ . , . Pags 3

WELL NO: 23»-13B {30) PROPERTY: Section 13B RED WASH FIELD

February 5, 1959

Fulled 2500¢ rods. Hung pump in thge

Backed off rods on top of pump, Finished pulling rods.
Installed BOP, flooring and t00g5e

" February 6, 1959

Pulled tubing.

Ran scrapper and 40 jts thg in hole. Hit paraffin at 1200%. .
Pushed paraffin with scrapper from 1200! to 3300° with tbg. Staried moving freely.
Flushing LO jts tbg with rig pump, I Jbs at a time.

February 7, 1959
Ran shopemade paraffin scraper to bottiom. :
Ran Halliburton drillsble magnesium bridge plug. Set at 56807,

February 8, 1959 ,

HeCullough gun perferated four 1/2" bullet holes per foot 5591=5597! (original
gamma log measurements). Checked sollars 5549=1/2, 5577-1/2 aid 56029,
Attempted to run Baker full bore rstainer. Stopped sbout 2200'. Pulled out to
TUN SCYaper.

February 9, 1959

Ran 15h jts tbg in hole to top of bridge pluge
Circulated for 1 hr., L5 min. to clean up well,
Pulled 194 jts tbg andscraprer.

February 10, 1959

Ren full bore packer and set st 55607, Swabbed thg dry, waited 1 hr., tbg still dry.-
Recovered Rangely crude and small amount of Red Wash orude gas cube Very smell
amount of water. - o '
Perf., the following zones w/l = 1/2" bullets r £t, 56hE=52, 5634-h0, S561l26,
56Qli=10, and 5585-91¢, Using collars 55L8-1/2, 5577, 5602, 5628, 565k ~ Gama log
measurements.

Lost 67 gun in hole after shooting last zone,

Tested BOP w/1000 psi.

February 11, 1959

McCullough Lished out 6% gun,

Dowell sand/oil squeszed intervalse. 56L48-52, 563L4~h0, 561L=26, 560410, 5591=97 &
5585-91, using 200 bbls burner fuel, 12600# 20-40 ottawa sand, LCO# adomite and 120
nylon {neoprene coabted) balls. Flushed w/210 bbls burner fuel,

Breakdown 1500 psi

Maximum pressure 1900 psi

Average rate sand and oil 37 BPH

average rate flush 28 BPY,

February 12, 1959
Cle aned ouvt sand from 5656 o 5680,
Rigged up to drill out megnesium bridge plug,
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WELL NO: 23-13B8 PROPEITY: Section 138 RED WASH FIEID

a2t

February 13, 1959 !

Finished drilling out plug hrd pushed to 58100,
Ran 23" tbg and landasd at 5745.16.

. Prod., String

XB to TH iho15

19L jbs tbg 5690.21

PEN - : 1.10

Pup 10,00

Gas Anchor. 30,00
g?ﬂg ut’é

February 1h, 1959

Ran rods:

Detail:

1 - 22 x 13" Poney rod
1-2%x 7/8% Poney rod
87 = 25 x 7/8% rods

79 = 25 x 3/4" rods

61 - 25 x 3/4* rods plain
Sargent #86

3 cup tope
Rig released,

T, R, HULL
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Torm 3-331 ’ U AD STATES SUBMIT IN Tl‘
i }fmf«/ DEPARTM*OF THE INTERIOR ‘oahas e
~7 GEOLOGICAL SURVEY

TE®

re-

\ . Form approved.
Budget Bureaun No. 42-R1424,

J
5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND EERIAL NO.

U-081

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to & different reservolr.
Use “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such propossl )

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBZ NAME

; Y
W @ W O o £ Mgy

7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

Red Wash

2. KAME OF OPERATOR S 979 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME
. : 3 Diy,
Chevron U.S.A. Inc. SION of | Red Wash Unit
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR e 9. WELL NO.

30 (23-13B) .

P. 0. Box 599, Denver, Colorado 80201 /s\/

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any
See also space 17 below.)
At surface

1888.5 FSL and 1923.8 FEL (NW,SW)

10. FIELD AND POOL, OE WILDCAT

Red Wash Green River

11, s®C,, T, B, ¥_, OB BLK. AND
BURVEY OR ABEA

Sec 13, T7S, R23W

i4. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, ete.) 12. COUNTY OR PARISH| 13. STATE
5784.6 GR Uintah Utah
16. , Check Appropriate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:
TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL Ok ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF BEPAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TEEATMENT ALTERING CASING
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON® SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT®*
REPAIE WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)

{NoTE : Report results of multiple completion on Well

(Othber) Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true verticnl depths for all markers and zones perti-

nent to this work.) *

It is proposed to perforate, acidize and frac well as follows:
1. MI and RU. Hot oil annulus and unseat pump. POOH w/rods and pump. ND tree.

NU BOPE. POOH w/tubing and anchor catcher.

2. RIH w/bit, csg scraper, and tubing to CO to PBTD of 5810

clean w/2% KCL wtr. ©POOH.
3. Perforate. See attached.
4., Acidize. See attached.

Circ hole -

5. Frac. Use Super~Emulsifrac fluid. H20 phase to be 2% KCL wtr coniaining
50 1b/1000 WG-12 gel and 3 gal/1000 SEM emulsifier. O0il phase to be Rangely

crude.
6. RIH:-w/sand bailer, to CO sand fill. POOH.
7. RIH w/tbg, pump assembly and rods.
8. Place well on production.

OfL, GAS, AND MINING

3-
APPROVED BY THE DIVISION OF Sec 723

3~ USGS
2—- State
Partners
1— File
- JCB

o 27, /7’74 |
]4«/ /1%%4/»/&/\

Fo additiona? QLE;';-- ﬂ

gisturbancesgﬁgu

18. I hereby certify th4t the foregoin true and correct
SIGNED M 4 277744 mirog Engineering Assistant

parg  August 22, 1979

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE

DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side
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WELL RAME: 30 (23-13B)

-

FIELD: Red Wash —

PROPOSED PERFORATING PROCEDURE

1. éhanges intended:

-

2. Results anticipated: Increased production .

3. Copditions of well which warrant such work: . .

4., To be ripped or shot: shot

5. . Depth,. nuzber and size of shots (or depth of rips): 3 CJPF

5210-22 : o .
5186-90

6. Date last Log of well filed:

i. Anticipated additional surface disturbahces: None
B8. FEstimated work date: Sept. 30, 1979

8. Present production and status:

8/179 21 25 106



WELL NAME: 30 (23-13B)
FIELD: Red Wash
?ROPOSED TREATMENT PROCEDURE
1. Objeétive: Iﬁcreased production .
2. Size and type of treatment: 3800 gal/7-1/2% NE acid.
3. Intervals to be treated: 5186-5797
‘4. Treatment down casing or tubing: Tubing
5. Method of 10caliziqg its effects: 1400 lgs - 507 Bené;ic acid flakes 507
- T . Napthalene :
6. Disposal of treating fluid: Spent acid will be swabbed back.
7. Name of company to do work: Dowell, Halliburton or Western-
8. Anticipated additional surface disturbances:\ None
9. Estimated work date: Sept. 30, 1979
10.

Present status, current production and producing interval:

Date : BOPD MC¥D BWPD

8/79 21 25 _ 106
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Form 9-531 ) Form Approved.
Dec. 1973 Budget Bureau No. 42—R1424
UNITED STATES 5 LEASE
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR U~-081
GEOLOGICAL SURVEY 6. IFINDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

{Do not use this form for proposals to drilt or to deepen or plug back to a different Red WaSh

reservoir. Use Form 9-331-C for such proposals.) 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

1. oil &l gas ] Red Wash Unit
well well other 9. WELL NO.

2. NAME OF OPERATOR 30 (23-13B)
Chevron U.S .A._ Inc. . - e -~ - _1~10, FIELD.OR WILDCAT-NAME e

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR Red Wash-Green River
P. 0. Box 599, Denver, CO 80201 11. SEC., T., R., M., OR BLK. AND SURVEY OR

4. LOCATION OF WELL (REPORT LOCATION CLEARLY. See space 17 AREA
below.) Sec. 13, T7S, R23E
AT SURFACE: 1888.5' FSI, & 1923.8' FFL (NW SW) 12. COUNTY OR PARISH| 13. STATE
AT TOP PROD. INTERVAL: .

_ : Uintah Utah

AT TOTAL DEPTH: 7 14. APl NO.

16. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE,
REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 15. ELEVATIONS (SHOW DF, KDB, AND WD)

5784.6 GR

REQUEST FOR APPROVAL TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF [ O

FRACTURE TREAT &l

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE [l K

REPAIR WELL D I:l (NOTE: Report results of multiple completion or zone
PULL OR ALTER CASING [} | change on Form 9-330.)

MULTIPLE COMPLETE ] Il ‘

CHANGE ZONES O O

ABANDON* il O

(other)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates,
including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and
measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

This well has been perforated, acidized and fractured as follows:

1. MI & RU. Unseat pump. POOH w/rods & pump. ND Tree. NU BOPE. POOH
w/tubing and anchor catcher.

RIH w/bit, csg scraper, and tubing to CO to PBTD of 5810'. Circ hole
clean w/2% KCl wtr. POOH. »
Perforate and acidize. See attached.

Frac. See attached.

RTH w/sand bailer to CO sand fill. POOH. RIH w/tbg, pump assembly & rods.

Placed well on production, monitor closely for 1 week.
No £dd1ts pan N
d1 ceditional surfaed
BUUrbaences reqyd ras
for thie - equA.ra‘i
2 0 I ___Set@ Ft.

N

S bW

Subsurface Safety Valve: Manu. and Type

21, 1980

[ S o NS
AN L0 J0U

18. | hereby éer;tify that the foregoing is true and correct
e fri a1 //F 21 /5 . ..
SIGNED 4 £ /"'/".//r y /77///\ virie _Engineering Asst. pare

Jan.

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE . DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY: - ) ‘ D‘\"S‘»O,\l O:
3 - USGS 1 - JCB Qi GAS & MINING
2 - State 1 - Sec 723
— Partners 1 - File -

*See Instructions on Reverse Side
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WELL NAME: RWU 30 (23-13B)

F1ELD: Red Wash- Green River

COMPLETED PERFORATING PROCEDURE

1. . Depth, number and size of shots (or depths of rips):

Size and Type Depth Number
4" High Performance 5210-22 36
3sp.F. -~ Tsigesige U T T 12

2. Conpany doing work: 0il Well Perforators, Inc., Denver, Colorado

a

3. Date of work: 10/9/79

4. Additional surface distrubances: Nome.
5. Production af;er work:
Date BOPD MCFD BWPD
* : 127

11/79 26



-

. . . ‘/.

«WELL NAME _ RWU 30 (23-13B)

FIELD NAME Red Wash—~Green River

11.

COMPLETED TREATMENT PROCEDURE

Size and type of treatment: 19,000 gal/2% KCl Base Super-K.
' S Prop: 2000 1b 100 mesh, 13,500 1b 20/40,
6000 1b 10/20. '

5781-97, 5695-5752, 5585-5652, 5186-5222

Treatment down casing or tubing: Tubing.

Intervals treated:

Methods uséd to localize effects: 507 benzoic acid flakes - 50% (Napthalene)
moth balls used as diverting agents.

Disposal of treating fluid: Spent acid was swabbed back.

Depth to which well was cleaned out: 5797!
"Date of work: 10/79

Company who performed work: Western.
Production interval:

Status and production before treatment:

Date * BOPD MCFD BWPD

8/79 21 25 106

Status and production after treatment:

Date BOPD MCFD BWPD

11/79 26 127



REPORT OF UNDESIRABLE EVENT
NTL—3A (EFFECTIVE MARCH 1, 1979)

To: District Engineer 8-5-6757 B LM .Fluid Minerals, P. O. Bos 1037 Vernal, Utah 84078
From: Chevron U.S.A. Inc., P. 0. Box 599, Denver, Colorado 80201 -

1. Spill _X _ Discharge Blowout Accident Fire or Explosion

N .
2. BBLS Discharged: __=_2 Bbls. BBLS Lost: 0

3. Contained on location: Yes X No

4 Date and time of event: _10-31-84 / i 8:00_am
-

5 Date and time reported to U.S.G.S.: __10-31-84 / 10:55 / A1 McKee

6. Location of event: _Red Wash Unit / #2 line heater on RWU 23-13B. ;75’ LT e /2

7. Specific nature and cause of event
Hole developed in coils of line heater. O0il came out of pressure relief valve.

8. Describe resultant damage:

g. Time required for control of event: .None upon discovery.

10. Action taken to control and contain:

Line heater bypassed. / Small pit dug. Oil scooped by backhoe into pit and

mixed with warm fluid. All fluid sucked out and taken to Central Battery
for rocq(

11. Action taken toqprevent recurrence:

Coils changed out

12. Cause of death:

OV B RN

— i m . -
- §oate

13, Other agencies notified: ‘ : BEASION OF Ot
Utah State Dept. of Health/Bureau of Water Pollution Control GAS & MiNING
State of Utah Dept. of Natural Resources.

14. Other pertinent information:
Copies sent to agencies not

Signature

Ao bl ' Date 10-31-84

T~ Assistant Production Foreman/ Red Wash Unit




Chevron U.SA. Inc.
‘ 700 South Colorado Blvd., P. 0. Box 599, Denver, CO 80201

Chevron

October 31, 1984

R. H. Elliott
Area Superintendent

RECEIVER .

(PN 1584

OWiSton 5 gy
State of Utah Department of Natural Resources GAS & MiNiNG
Division of 0il, Gas & Mining
4241 State Office Building
Salt Lake City, UT 84114

Attention Mr. Ron Firth

Gentlemen:

The attached spill report will confirm our recent telephone report to yoﬁr
office of a spill of two barrels of crude o0il from line heater Number 2 at

well #23-13B in the Red Wash Unit located in Uintah County, Utah, on October
29, 1984 at 10:30 A.M.

Two barrels of crude oil were recovered and hauled to oil salvage pit at Red
Wash Unit. WNo spilled material reached any navigable stream bed or tributary.

Very truly yours,

Nfredigun,
f‘"’ R. H. Elliott

MLS: js
Attachment

cc: Mr. 0. M. Paschke



e

. QILL REPORT TO REGULATORY AGENCIES
“ CHEVRON U.S,A. INC., CENTRAL REGION
0 P.0. BOX 599
” DENVER, CO 80201

Field/Facility: Line heater #2 at Well #23-13B in Red Wash Unit

Location: Township 7g Range 23F Section 13 QTR/QTR NWSE
County: Uintah
State: Utah

-

Date of Spill/Time: October 31, 1984 at 8:00 A.M.

Fluid Spilled: 0il o Bbls, Water 0 Bbls, Other 0 Bbls
Fluid Recovered: 0il 5 Bbls, Water 0 ___Bbls, Other 0 Bbls

Agencies Notified/Date/Time: Telephoned by R. K. Wackowski:

-BLM, Fluid Minerals, Vernal (Al McKee) 10/31/84 10:55 A.M.

~-Utah Dept. of Health - Water Pollution (receptionist) 10/31/84 10:00 A.M.

-Utah Dept. of Natural Resources'(Ron Firth) 10/31/84 10:05 A.M.
elephoned by M. L. Swetnam %

-BPA, Region VIII, Denver (Julie Mahomey) 10/31/84 10:50 A.M.

How spill occurred: Heating coil in line heater sprung a leak and filled treater
causing two barrels of crude oil to come out the pressure relief valve and spill
onto the ground. No spilled material reached any navigable stream bed or tributary.

Control and cleanup methods used:

~ Bypassed the treater.
- Cleaned up two barrels crude oil and dirt and hauled to oil salvage pit at

Red Wash Central Battery

Estimated damage:

- no land damage
- Estimated clean up cost $200.00.

Action taken to prevent recurrence:

-Replace broken heating coil in treater.

Who to contact for further information:

Mr. R. K. Wackowski:

Assistant Production Foreman
Chevron U.S.A. :Inc.

Red Wash Unit

P.0. Box 455

-Vernal, Utah 84078 :
. Date Report P d
(801) 789-2442 ate hepor repare




SPILL REPORT TO REGULATORY AGENCIES
CHEVRON U.S.A. INC., CENTRAL REGION
P.0. BOX 599
DENVER, CO 80201

Field/Facility: Faulty valve on flowline from 23-13B in Red Wash Unit

Location: Township 7S Range 23E Section 13 QTR/QTR NWSE
County: Uintah

State: Utah

Date of Spill/Time: March 25, 1985 at-31:15 a.m.

Fluid Spilled: 0il 1.5 Bbls, Water: 0O Bbls, Other 0 Bbls
Fluid Recovered: 0il 0 Bbls, Water 0 Bbls, Other 0 Bbls

Agencies Notified/Date/Time: Telephoned by Daisy Joslin:

- BLM, Fluid Minerals, Craig (Allen McKee) 3/25/85, 11:55 a.m.
- Utah Dept. of Health - Water Poll. (Steve McNeal) 3/25/85, 11:57 a.m.
- Utah Dept of Natural Resources {John Baza) 3/25/85, 1:40 p.m.
- EPA, Region VIII, Denver (Julie Mahoney) 3/25/85, 12:03 p.m.

How spill occurred:

0il had set up in flowline due to very cold temperature and was being pushed
by hot oil from a hot o0il truck and valve in the freeze box blew off and al-
lowed oil and gas to shoot up in the air and 1.5 barrels of crude oil settled
on the ground. No spilled material reached any navigable stream bed or tri-
butary.

Control and cleanup;methodé used:

Shut off the flow. Dirt and spilled o0il will be raked up and picked up with
shovels and spread on field roads. SuNDﬂy notice being prepared.

Estimated damage:

No land damage. Estimated clean-up cost - $1,500.

Action taken to prevent recurrence:

Defective valve replaced with a new valve.

Who to contact for further information:

Mr. R. K. Wackowski
Assistant Production Foreman
Chevron U.S.A. Inc.

d h Unit
geo W;ix 4?; .March 25, 1985

Vernal, UT 84078 Date Report Prepared

(801) 789-2442
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REPORT OF UNDESIRABLE EVENT RECEIVED

NTL-3A (EFFECTIVE MARCH 1, 1979)

MAR 2 7 1385

To: District Manager, B.L.M., Fluid Minerals : OF OiL
From: Chevron U.S.A. Inc,, P. O. Box 599, Denver, Colorado 80201 ngglg‘:mﬂm@

[ 3N

1. Spill _X _ Discharge Blowout Accident Fire or Explosion

2. BBLS Discharged: _1% Bbls Crude oil BBLS Lost: 1% Bbls. Crude oil

3. Contained on location; Yes X No

4. Date and time of event: __3-25-85 / 11:15 am

5. Date and time reported to B L.M.: 3-25-85 / 11:55 am

6. Location of event: © - R ‘23—13B Flowline in freezebox between #2 and #3 line heaters.

7. Specific nature and cause of event
Flowline was-set up and being pushed by hot oil truck. Valve in freezebox blew off

causing oil and gas to shoot up in air. Wind spread oil thinly over ground.

8. Describe resultant damage: - )
Valve. in freezebox blew off causing oil and gas to shoot up in air.
Wind spread oil thinly over gound.
No spilled material reached any navigable stream bed or tributary.
9. Time required for control of event: none upon discovery.

10. Action taken to'control and contain:
Line isolated on both sides of leak. Dirt and oil raked up to be spread on road.
Freezebox dug up and line repaired. '

11. Action taken to prevent recurrence:
Valve replaced with new valve.

12. Cause of death:

*13. Other agencies notified:
Utah State Dept. of Health, Bureau of Water Pollution / Steve McNeal / 3-25-85/11:57a

State of Utah Dept. of Natural Resources / John Baza / 3-25-85 / 1:40 pm
EPA Region VIII / Julie Mahoney / 3-25-85 / 12:03 pm
14. Other pertinent information:

Signature . Date _‘3,/2678-;

Title Assistant Production Foreman, Red Wash Unit

TIN # 94/1497173
* A COPY OF THIS FORM WAS MAILED TO EACH AGENCY LISTED IN PARAGRAPH 13 ABOVE.
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>

“ Chevron

Chevron USA. Inc.

‘ 700 South Colorado Bivd., P. 0. Box 539, Denver, CO 80201
March 26, 1985

R. H. Elliott
Area Superintendent

State of Utah Department of Natural Resources

Division of 0il, Gas, and Mining DIVISION OF p“—
355 West North Temple GAS & MiNI

3 Traid Center, Ste. 350

Salt Lake City, UT 84180-1203

Attention Mr. John Baza

Gentlemen:

The attached spill report will confirm our recent telephone report to your
office of a spill of one and one half barrels of crude oil from a faulty valve
on flowline from 23-13B location in Red Wash Unit located in Red Wash field,
Uintah County, Utah, on March 25, 1985, at 11:15 a.m.

None of the crude oil was recovered. It was all mixed with dirt and so will
be picked up and spread on field roads. No spilled material reached any navi-
gable stream bed or tributary.

Very truly yours,

) e T
f"' R. H. El?iott

MLS:pt
Attachment

cc: Mr. 0. M. Paschke
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UNITED STATES .- FoRMammovD

Pessmper tur DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR : B
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT T3 Tenne Devgravon na Somd < -
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS = lHL(‘\flmm, pra s

Do not uss this form for proposals to drill or to deepen of reen:try\(o;‘gagmeren( reservoir.

Usa "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such progosal

i T Urut ot CA. Agreement Designation

Red Wash

.SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE

.Note, Repont results of muluple compieuon oa well Completion of

1. Type of Well |
o 3% (B ose "H" Station - STV S wa Yo, QWU 30
2. Nume of Openitof . O ‘. "H" Station
Chevron U.S.A. Inc., Room 13097 T i S 3. AP Well o. oW
3. Address and Telephone No. . 43cy 7151 =77
~'P.0. Box 599, Denver, CO 80201 (303) 930-3691 . [770 Fld 1nd Pool. of Esploratony Area
3 Locivon of Wel tFoouge, Sec.. To R M. or Sur-¢y Descrnpuor; ] Red Wash
NEI{; SElﬁ 11. County or Prnish. Sute
Sec. 13, T7S, R23E | ' Uintah, Utah
12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION | : TYPE OF ACTION
B o — AT =] .
@ Nouce of Intent l Atindoament D Change of Plans
: ™ . O
: i___ Recompieuon New Consaucuon
C] Sussequent Report ! Q Plugping Bact D Non-Routine Frazunsg
. ) I, L Casuag Repur D Water Shut-Off
L Fual Abandonment Nouce i ; Alerzg Caning D Conversion to Injecuca
i X ower Venting
|

Recompleuon Report and Log form.)

13 Descrbe Propased or Campizied Operaoons \Clearly sute all perunent ceaauls, ane give perunent dates. including estmated date of sarung any propased work I weil i direeiionduly rdles
pive sudsurface locauses and measured and true verucal depths for all marxen and 10nes perunent 1o s work.)®

It may be necessary to vent all produced gas at "H" Station due to

C0z breakthrough at the following locations: 32-13B, 42-13B, 12-18C,
22-18C, 23-18C, 34-18C, 24-18C, 14-18C, 44-13B, 34-138, 21-24B, 24-13B,
23-13B, 33-13B. This is needed to prevent loss of gas sales due to

an off-spec. situation. The gas would need to be vented until the

€0z levels subside enough to allow the gas to be returned to the system.

A subsequent report of total volumes will foilow. 3-BLM
. 3-State
e e e ' 1-JRB
["ACCEPTED BY THE STATE 1-GAP
 OF UTAH DIVISIpN OF 1-Cont- File
wic , -

ragarat soprovat of tiis e+ Ol GAS, ANPAIIR,

is roguived before gomA ‘DATE: /

opereliors. B L

14, [ heredy

cerg mxyo gown true and corTect - - T e e e
Signed 4;2g7$,457%?lgﬁﬁhg) Tide Technical Assistant owe 9/21/90

(Thus spebe for Foderal of Sute office use)

Approved by

Tide Date

Conditons of ipproval, if aay:

Tde 18 U §.C. Secoon 1001, mekes it 3 erume for way penon Eowagly 1xd wilfully 1o maks 10 Loy desarTnem of agendy of the Uruted Sams any false. ficuoous of fraudulent suates

oF reomeu—ranoay ot 19 eev -ner withia s unddituon. ’




Form 3160-§ IQFED STATES I FORM APPROVED

(June 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR B"%"“ﬁ:ﬁ:ﬁs%ﬂ”
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT e .
5. Lease Designation and Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-08l1
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. - -
Use *APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposals 6. 1 Indian, Alloftee or Tribe Name
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE 7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation
. Type ot Wel Red Wash
X wen (I wer I other 8. Well Name and No.
2. Name of Operator 30 (23-138)
Chevron U.S.A. Inc. 9. API Well No.
3. Address and Telephone No. 43 - 04 7 - ]. 5 1 5 7
P.O. Box 599, DenveY‘, CO 80201 (303) 930'3691 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R., M., or Survey Description) Red Was h
11. County or Parish,
1888.5" FSL, 1923.8’ FEL (NW/SW) 1 Uiéia; J?:h
Section 13, T7S-R23E ’

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

D Notice of Intent Abandonment DChangc of Plans

Recompletion New Construction

00

m Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing
Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

D Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection

oter__Shut In DDispo.eWam

(Note) Report results of muitiple completion on Well
Completion of Recompietion Report and Log form.)

kd OJ0IC]

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

As of 9/1/91 the subject well is shut in.

3-BLM
3-State
1-JRB
1-Well File
L 1-JLW
1-Sec 724R
) 1-COS
e 2-Partners

14. 1 hereby certify’ f Tue,
&pﬁy gggaj% /ﬁi/{(/Z rie_Permit Specialist pate 9/13/91
(This space fox"Fedenl or State office use)

Approved by: Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any:

Titke 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or frauduleat statements or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

% See instruction on Reverse Side



Form 3160-5 . UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(June 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR B s Mok 31, 1995
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT -
5. Lease Designation and Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U - 081
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. If Indian, Allottes or Tribe Name
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposals
SUBMIT /N TRIPL ICATE 7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation
RED WASH
1. Type of Well
Oil Gas
m Well D Well D Other 8. Well Name and No.
30 (23-13B)
2. Name of Operator
CHEVRON U.S.A PRODUCTION CO. 9. API Well No.
3. Address and Telephone No. 43-047-15157
P.0. BOX 599, DENVER, CO. 80201 303 930-3691 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. [{mﬁon ofFVée\l-l‘ (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) RED WASH - GRN. RIVER
PNy, 1924 FWL, SEC. 13, T7S, R23E  OINTA UTA
12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D Notice of Intent D Abandonment DChange of Plans
D Recompletion DNcw Construction
m Subscquent Report D Plugging Back DNon-Routine Fracturing
D Casing Repair DWater Shut-Off
D Final Abandonment Notice D Altering Casing DOonversion to Injection
m other STATUS DDispose Water
(Note) Report results of multiple compietion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

THIS WELL IS SHUT IN WHILE UPGRADING WELL TEST FACILITIES. EWILL RE-EVALUATE STATUS AFTER WELL TEST FACILITIES
UPGRADES HAVE BEEN COMPLETED.

3 - BLM
3 - STATE
1-JTC ng 2l
g vf’j g S
1 - WELL FILE INhs
1-JLW s
APR 15 i¢
/
DIVISION CF
OIL GAS & MINING
14. 1 hereby certify the fopegoing is frue and correct
Signed AR /%Z’:?ﬁ%; Tite __PERMIT SPECIALIST Date ___4/6/92
Wﬁmﬂuw officeuse 3]
Approved by: Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.




- o ® v/
. Chevron
Chevron USA. Inc.
U P.O. Box 455, Vernal, UT 84078 « Phone (801) 783-2442

FEBRUARY 15, 1993

ANNUAL REPORT OF

SHUT-IN WELLS - ,
. . WONSITS VALLEY. STATE/FEDERAL UNIT
‘”“’UINTAH COUNTY, "UTAR -

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
170 SOUTH 500 EAST
VERNAL, UT 84078

. GENTLEMEN:
Enclosed, please find the annual report of shut-in wells in Red
Wash Unit. If you have any questions, please call the above
address.
Sincerely,
J.T. CONLE

AREA OPERATIONS SUPERVISOR

sdn
Enclosures

cc: State of Utah
Department of Natural Resources
Division of 0il, Gas and Mining
355 West North Temple : -
3 Triad Center, Suite 350 :
Salt Lake City, UT 84180-1203

.

||

P

| @Eﬁ
FEB 18 1993

DIVISION OF
OlL GAS & MINING
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Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
(June 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR : Expires: March 31, 1993

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

S. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-081

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposals 6 Ifindan, or Tribe Name

. 7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE Red Wash Unit
1. Type of Well
oil Gas
m Well D Well D Other
8. Well Name and No.

— RUW #30 (23-13B)

Chevron U.S.A. Inc. 9. APl Well No.
3. Address and Telephone No. . 43-047-15157

P.O. Box 455, Vernal, Utah 84078 (801) 789-2442 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

Red Wash-Grm. River

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)

11. County or Parish, State

NL, 1924 FWL, SEC. 13, T7S, R23E Uintah, Utah
\884°¢5) -
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

D Notice of Inteat D Abandonment D Change of Plans
D Recompletion D New Construction

[ZI Subsequent Report D Phugging Back D Nou-Routine Fracturing
D Casing Repair D Water Shut-Off

D Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing D Cauversion to Injection
m Other D Dispose Water

(Note) Report resuits of multiple completion ca Well Completion
or Recompletioa Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operati (Clwlymteallpeninmtduai]s,mdgivepeﬂimmdam,inchxdinguﬁmtcd&neofmrﬁnganypmpaedwk If well is directionally drilled, give
subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Well test facility upgrades were completed in 1992, We plan to re-evaluate this shut-in production well during 1993.

pesstvey

FEB 18 1993
DIVISION OF
OIL GAS & MINING
Do Baustet v
(This space for Federal or State office use)
Approved by: Tide __ Date

Conditions of approval, if any:

FVLARB-6.BLM LJRL #2)



F:‘orm:ld()-S . UNITED STATES ‘

(June 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals

FORM APPROVED
Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
Expires: March 31, 1993

S. Lease Designation and Senial No.
U-081

5. If indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE

7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

1. TypeofWel

Ot Gas
®> O O

RED WASH UNIT

F;. Well Name and No.

RWU #30 (23-13B)

2. Name of Operator
CHEVRON U.S.A. PRODUCTION COMPANY

o. AP Well No.

3. Address and Telephone No.
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH, VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 (801) 781-4302

43-047-15157

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Locaton of Well (Footage, Sec., T.. R., M., or Survey Description}

RED WASH-GRN. RIVER

IT. County of Parish, State
752' FNL. 1924' FWL, SEC. 13, T7S/R23E UINTAH, UTAH
1z CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
Notice of intent D Abandonment D Cuange of Plans
Recompletion D New Construction
D Subsequent Report Plugging Back D Non-Routine Fractunng
D Casing Repair D Water Shut-Off
D Final Abandonment Notice D Altening Casing D Convession to Injection
D Other D Dispose Water

(Notel

Report results of multiple completion on Weli

Completon or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13.  Describe Proposed or Compieted Op {Clearly state all pentinent detaiis. and give pert dates. including
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work}

We propose to complete the subject well as follows:

. MIRLU.

. Clean out to 5175' with bit and scraper.

. Set CIBP at 5150'.

. Hvdrotest in hole to S000 PSI with packer and tubing. Set packer at 4600’ and test.

. Flow/swab test well.
. RDMO.

AN I -

Accepted by the
Utah Divicion of
Oil, Gas c:¢ "irning

d date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilied.

. Swab tubing down and perforate the following intervals using 4 JSPF: 4997-5020' (Hf). 4929-4948' (Hc), 4715-4722' (Gh). 4642-4648' (Ga).

ﬂ __EOR RECORD ONLY
; i . ..
14. | hereby ¥ foref omgasy ¢
. \7 PN < . . 2
Signed e U Tile  Operations Assistant Daz2 06/14/94
(This space for Federal or State office use)
Approved by: Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes 1 a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictiuous or fraudulent statements or

representations as to any matter withm its jurisdiction.

*See instruction on Reverse Side



FORM APPROVED
Budget Buresu No. 1004-0135
Expires: March 31, 1993

Form 3160-5 ' UNITED STATES
(June 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTE]
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGE

IR 5. Lease Designation and Serial No.
L

e A P AN 5 4104

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS.ON w% v-081
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry ta a'dil ' £ Gostuuit
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals |6 \findian, Allottee or Tribe Name
Sl-]BMlT IN TRIPLICATE 7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

1. Typeof Well RED WASH UNIT

[o}1} Gas
Well D Well D Other T 'Well Namic and No,

RWU #30 (23-13B)

2. Name of Operator

CHEVRON U.S.A, PRODUCTION COMPANY P. APl Well No.
3. Address and Telephone No. 43-047-15157
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH, VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 (801) 781-4302 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) RED WASH-GRN. RIVER
' 7 11. County or Parish, State
752’ FNL, 1924* FWL, SEC. 13, T7S/R23E UINTAH, UTAH
12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
Notice of Intent D Abandonment D Change of Plans
D Recompletion D New Construction
D Subsequent Report D Plugging Back D Non-Routine Fracturing
D Casing Repair D Water Shut-Off
D Final Abandonment Notice D Altering Casing D Conversion to Injection
Other  Well Status D Dispose Water
(Note) Report results of multiple compietion on Well
Compietion or Recompletion Repost and Log form.)

13, Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state aif pertinent details, and give pertn dates, includi i d date of starting any proposed work. 1f well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)

TA approval is requested for this well, which is believed to have gas recompietion potential. Gas potential will be tested sometime during the next five years.

14.  1hereby af foregoings true an A /
Signed Q( Tie  Operations Assistant Date 08/30/94

-

I

(This space for Federal or State office use) ~

Approved by: Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes ltscmnetormypemonlmowmglyandwﬂlﬁ.lllyto nmkewanydeparunemoragencyofmeUnnedStatuany&be. fictitious or frauduient statements or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

—-— a— — — — s re—— ——
- — ——— w— — — pa— —

*See instruction on Reverse Side
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Form 3160-5

UNITED STATES =~
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ,
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENTGED — | I

(June 1990)

FORM APPROVED
Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
Expires: March 31, 1993

:’\ ;‘ B
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ONWELEI?S?‘;’

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a idiﬁ"ersnt’rrewxj(olr ,

- Lexse Designation and Seral No.

U-081

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals

r. if Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

. i Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE
1. Type of Well RED WASH UNIT
oil Gas
Well D Well D Other "~ Well Name and No.
RWU #30 (23-13B)

2. Name of Operator R

CHEVRON U.S.A. PRODUCTION COMPANY 9. APl Well No.
3. Address and Telephone No. 43-047-15157

11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH, VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 (801) 781-4302
Lacation of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., of Survey Description)

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

RED WASH-GRN. RIVER

752’ FNL, 1924 FWL, SEC. 13, T7S/R23E

11. County or Parish, State

UINTAH, UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

Other  Well Status

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
Nctce of Intent D Abandonment D
D Recompletion D
D Subsequent Report D Plugging Back D
] e O
D Final Abandonment Notice D Altering Casing D

O

(Note)

Change of Plans

New Construction

Non-Routine Fracturing

Water Shut-Off

Conversion to [njection

Dispose Water

Report results of multiple completion on Well

Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

give subsurface locanons and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)

TA approval is requested for this well, which is believed to have gas recompletion potential. Gas p

Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state ali pertinent details. and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. 1f well is directionally drilled,

ial will be tested sometime during the next five years,

(“ e
14. ] hereby / .
Signed Cf Tide  Operations Assistant Date 08/30/94
l —

(This space for Federal ot State office use) ~

Approved by: Title Date

Conditions of approval. if any
e —————————
—————————

Title 18 U.5.C.. Section lO()T,Tnakes it @ orime for any person kn-o;ingly and wilTnTlly to make to any ;epanment or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or

representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

s— — —
—

S— R ——

*See instruction on Reverse Side




Fom 3149-5 : ' UNITED STATES . . R
Qune 190 DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR' - ,
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT otP = 81994

FORM APPROVED
Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
Expires: Mach 31, 1993

Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON'WEEKAL GAS & MININ U-081

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a differentreservorr
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

7. 1f Unit or CA, Agreement Designanon

RED WASH UNIT

3. Well Name and No.

RWU #30 (23-13B)

P. APl Well No.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE
1. Typeof Well
oit Gas
Well D Well D Other
2. Name of Operator
CHEVRON U.S.A. PRODUCTION COMPANY
3. Address and Teizphone No.

11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH, VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 (801) 781-4302

43-047-15157

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

kS Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description}

RED WASH-GRN. RIVER

,‘le ?s\_ 11. County or Parish, State
P2 TNL. 1924 FWL, SEC. 13, T7S/R23E UVINTAH, UTAH
- CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D Nouce of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans
Recompletion New Construction

Plugging Back

Subsequent Report

D Final Abandonment Notice

Casing Repair

Altenng Casing

Other

HINmEE

Non-Routine Fracturing

Water Shut-Off

Conversion to Injection

Dispose Water

HinnIninn

(Note} Report results of multiple completon on Well
Completon or Rzcompletion Report and Log form.)

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all perunent details. and g:v2 pertinent dates, inciuding estmated date of starting any proposed work. {f well is directionaily dnlled,

give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)
The following work was compieted between 08/29/94 and 09/02/94:

. MIRU.

. RIH with bit and scraper.

. Set CIBP and 5157 cap CIPB with 25 sx. cement.

. Hydro-tested tubing at S500 PSI, good.

. Set 7” Lok-set packer at 4563°. Test casing to 500 PSI, no test communicated to tubing,

. Release packer. Test casing at 560 PSI, good. Set packer at 4564” test casing comm. to tubing. Set packer at 4568 same result.

. Set packer at 4535’ test tubing to 700 PSI. good. Swab well.
. Perforated with 4 JSPF: 4997-5020° (Hf), 4929-4948’ (Hc), 4715-4722° (Gh), 4642-4648" (Ga). Bleed off gas.
. Release packer and POOH.

1
2
3
4
5
6. Set packer at 4594° same result communicated to tubing.
7
8
9
0
1. Swab well. RDMO.

- -

/

Date 09/06/94

14, 1 hereby certify that the iug is true and correct.
Signed Tile  Petroleum Engineer

This space for Federal or State office use)

Approved by: : Tule

R

Conditions of approval. if any

Title 18 U.S.C. Secuon 1001, makes it a cnme for any person knowmgly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the Unuted States any false, fictitious or traudulént statements or

representations as 10 any matter within its junisdiction.

*See instruction on Reverse Side

GENERAL INSTRUCTIONS
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AY
Form 3160-5 ! UNITED STATES
> ** Qune 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals

FORM APPROVED
Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
Expires: March 31, 1993

o

. Lease Designation and Serial No.

[=)

. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE

~

. If Unitor CA, Agreement Desigpation

1. Typeof Well

Oil Gas
E] well D well E Other  MULTIPLE WELLS SEE ATTACHED LIST

RED WASH UNIT
I-SEC NO 761
I8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator

CHEVRON U.S.A. INC.

R

. APt Well No.

3. Address and Telephone No

11002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 (801) 781-4300

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Arca

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R., M., or Survey Description)

RED WASH - GREEN RIVER

11. County or Parish, State

UINTAH, UTAH

12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Abandonment

D Notice of Intent
Subgequent Report

D Final Abandonment Notice

Recompletion

Plugging Back

Casing Repair

Altering Casing

OO0

Other  CHANGE OF OPERATOR

Change of Plans

New Construction

Non-Routine Fracturing

Water Shut-Off

Conversion to Injection

Dispose Water

Hin|nINInn

(Note) Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13, Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If welt is directionally drilled,

give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)

As of January 1, 2000 Chevron U.S.A. INC. resigns as Operator of the Red Wash Unit.
The Unit Number is I-SEC NO 761 effective October 31, 1950.

The successor operator under the Unit Agreement will be
Shenandoah Energy Inc.

475 17th Street, Suite 1000

Denver, CO 80202

Agreed and accepted to this 29th day of December, 1999

RECEIVED
DEC 3 0 1999

DIVISION OF OlL, GAS & MINING

14, Dhereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.

Signed A, E, Wacker a . CC . (/(_) 17} Ck’kq Tile  Assistant Secretary Date 12/29/99
(This space for Federal or State office use)
Approved by: Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictiti

representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

or fraudul

or

*See instruction on Reverse Side



United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Utah State Office H EC E EVE @

P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155 FEB 07 2000

DIVISION OF
IN REPLY REFER TO OIL, GAS AND MINING

UT-931
February 4, 2000
Shenandoah Energy Inc.
Attn: Rae Cusimano
475 17" Street, Suite 1000
Denver, Colorado 80202
Re: Red Wash Unit
Uintah County, Utah
Gentlemen:

On December 30, 1999, we received an indenture whereby Chevron U.S.A. Inc. resigned as Unit
Operator and Shenandoah Energy Inc. was designated as Successor Unit Operator for the Red
Wash Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effective February 4,
2000. In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the
designated party has obtained all required approval that would entitle it to conduct operations
under the Red Wash Unit Agreement.

Your statewide (Utah) oil and gas bond No. 0969 will be used to cover all operations within the
Red Wash Unit.

It is requested that you notify all interested parties of the change in unit operator. Copies of the
approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriate federal offices, with one copy
returned herewith.

Sincerely,

/s/ Robert A. Henricks

Robert A. Henricks
Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals
Enclosure

cc: Chevron U.S.A. Inc.

bcce. F|eld Manager - Vernal (w/enclosure)
oIsionof Il Gas'&:Mining -+ -
Minerals Adjudication Group U-932
File - Red Wash Unit (w/enclosure)
MMS - Data Management Division
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron
UT931: TAThompson:tt:2/4/00




Page No. 4
02/04/00

Well Status Report

Utah State Office

Bureau of Land Mahagement

Lease Api Number Well Name QTR Section Township Range Well Status Operator
uTU081 4304715152 24 (34-14B) RED WASH SWSE 14 17 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu0566 4304730344 240 (12-36B) RED WAS SWNW 36T 7S R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTU081 4304730345 241 (22-14B) RED WAS SENW 14 7 7S R23E PGW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTUo81 4304730346 242 (42-13B) RED WAS SENE 13T17s R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu02148 4304730347 243 (42-18C) RED WAS SENE 18 7 78 R24E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTUu02149 4304730348 244 (23-19C) RED WAS NESW 19 717s R24E PGW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED

~UTSLOAIRE4— B 04 FE034 9245 —(H4—306)—REBRAS—SHSH——— 30T 78— R2AE—ABD—CHEVRON-U—S A TNCORPORATED
UTu02148 4304730387 246 (22-18C) RED WAS SENW R24E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTu02148 4304730388 247 (22-17C) RED WAS SENW PGW CHEVRON U § A INCORPORATED
CHEVYRON U S A~ INCORPORATED
CHEVRON U $ A INCORPORATED

~HFHORH P ————43 0473038924845 20E—RED—WASKESE 20-1-78 R24E—ABD
4304716476 25 (23-23B) RED WASH NESW

uTu082 WIW

utuosz2

uTu082

4304715156

4304731576

29 (32-23B) RED WASH

292 (42-23B) RED WAS

SWNE

SENE

23

23

7s

T7s

R23E

R23E

CHEVRON

CHEVRON U § A

UTug559 4304730458 258 (34-22A) RED WAS SWSE 2 178 R22E WIW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
STATE 4304732785 259 SWSW 16T 7S R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTtuos1 4304715153 26 (23-22B) RED WASH NESW 22 T 78 R23E TA CHREVRON U S A INCORPORATED
STATE 4304732786 260 SWSE 16 178 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTu0566 4304730517 262 (22-26B) RED WAS SENW 26 T 78 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTu0566 4304730518 263 (24-26B) RED WAS SESW 26 T 78 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTu0566 4304730519 264 (31-35B) RED WAS NWNE 3517 R23E WIW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTU0566 4304730520 265 (44-26B) RED WAS SESE 26 T 78 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTu0566 4304730521 266 (33-26B) RED WAS NWSE 26 T7s R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTuo116 4304732981 267 SWNE 17178 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTu0566 4304730522 269 (13-26B) RED WAS NWSW 26 T 7s R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTU081 4304715154 27 (43-14B) RED WASH NESE 14 T17S R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTuG566 4304731082 270 (22-35B) RED WAS SENW 35178 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu0566 4304731081 271 (42-358) RED WAS SENE 35178 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu082 4304731054 272 (44-23B) RED WAS SESE 23 717s R23E PGW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTU0566 4304731051 273 (42-27B) RED WAS SENE 27 178 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
O8RS 4304731883 R74 (13258 ) REDWAS - NWSW———25~F—78——R2FE—P+A—————CHEVRON-U-S—A—TNEORPORATED
uTuo566 4304731077 275 (31-26B) RED WAS NENW 26 1 7s R23E WIW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTu0566 4304731053 276 (44-27B) RED WAS SESE 27 T 78 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTU0566 4304731076 278 (11-26B) RED WAS NWNW 26 T 78 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
STATE 4304731052 279 (11-36B) RED WAS NWNW 367178 R23E WIW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTU081 4304715155 28 (43-22B) RED WASH NESE 2 17s R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTU0566 4304731079 280 (11-358) RED WAS NWNW 3577 R23E POM CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu0566 4304731080 282(42-26B) RED WAS SENE 26 T 78 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTuo116 4304732982 283 NESE 187178 R23E WIW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu082 4304731476 284 (33-23B) RED WAS NWSE 2317 7s R23E PGW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu082 4304731477 285 (11-24B) RED WAS NWNW 26 T 78 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTuo567 4304731478 286 (42-21B) RED WAS SENE 2117 7s R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTuoB 4304731512 287 (44-13B) RED WAS SESE 13717s R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTU0566 4304731513 288 (24-27B) RED WAS SESW 27T 1T 78 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTU082 4304731517 289 (13-24B) RED WAS NWSW 24 178 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
T POW USA

INCORPORATED

INCORPORATED




Page No.
02/04/00

Lease

UTU0559
UTu02148
uTuo81
uTu0566
uTyog1
uTU0566
uTuo116
uTtuog2
uTu081
uTU081
uTu082
uTuo116
UTu0830
uTu093

~STATE

Api Number

4304731581
4304731582
4304731577
4304731578
4304731579
4304731679
4304733018
4304715136
4304715157
4304731682
4304731683
4304731819
4304732538
4304732629

LR2OLAZALZD,

Well Name

293
294

(22-22A) RED WAS
(24-18C) RED WAS
295 (11-22B) RED WAS
296 (12-358) RED WAS
297 (24-15B) RED WAS
298 (22-27B) RED WAS
299

3 (34-23B) RED WASH
30 (23-13B) RED WASH
301 (43-15B) RED WAS
302 (22-24B) RED WAS
303 (34-178) RED WAS
305

306

Z0Z

Well Status Report
Utah State Office
Bureau of Land Management

QTR Section Township Range Well Status Operator

SENW 22 1 7S R22E 0SI CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
SESW 18T 7s R24E PGW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
NWNW 2T 7s R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
SWNW 351T7s R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
SESW 1517 7s R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
SENW 27 T 78 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
SWNE 18717 7s R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
SWSE 23 1T 78 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
NESW 131778 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
NESE 15717s R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
SENW 24 T 7S R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
SWSE 17 1778 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
NENE 4T 8S R24E PGW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
NESW 23 T 7S R24E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED

TTRTT

4304715158

AL

—SWSH——— 16T 78— R24GE—ABD—————CHEVRONU-S—A—INCORPORATED—

CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED

VRUN—U R—INCORPURRTED

~HTEEOFIE5 -ty TG B2 6B SR 29 T T R2GEABD - CHEVRON- U S—A—INCORPORATED—

uTUOBY 4304715160 33 (14-14B) RED WASH SWsw 1% 178 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTU081 4304715161 34 (23-14B) RED WASH NESW 1% 178 R23E WIW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu81 4304715162 35 (43-13B) RED WASH NESE 13717s R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTUo81 4304715163 36 (32-13B) RED WASH SWNE 13178 R23E POM CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu082 4304715165 38 (14-23B) RED WASH SWsSW 231 7s R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu0561 4304715166 39 (14-24A) RED WASH SWSW 26 T 78 R22E TA CHEVRON U § A INCORPORATED
uTu081 4304715137 4 (41-22B) RED WASH NENE 22 T17s R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTyo82 4304715167 40 (21-24B) RED WASH NENW 26T 78 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
utuos1 4304715168 41 (34-13B) RED WASH SWSE 1371778 R23E POMW CHEVRON U § A INCORPORATED
UTSLO071965 4304715169 42 (21-29C) RED WASH NENW 29 T 78 R24E PGW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
+ UTU0116 4304715170 43 (12-178) RED WASH SWNW 177178 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTU0829 4304715171 44 (32-33C) RED WASH SWNE 33T17s R24E PGW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTU02030 4304715172 45 (23-30B) RED WASH NESW 30178 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTUo80 4304715173 46 (41-21C) RED WASH NENE 21778 R24E  PGW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu02030 4304715174 48 (32-19B) RED WASH SWNE 19178 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu02025 4304715175 49 (12-29B) RED WASH SWNW 291 7S R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTyo82 4304715138 5 (41-23B) RED WASH NENE 23 T 7s R23E POV CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu0559 4304715176 50 (14-23A) RED WASH SWSW 23178 R22E  POU CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
STATE 4304715177 51 (12-16B) RED WASH SWNW 16178 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTuo0116 4304715178 52 (14-18B) 'RED WASH SWSW 187178 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
T U S A INCORPORATED

uTu0561 4304715179 53 (41-25A) RED WASH NENE 257178 R22E POV CHEVRON

UTU02030 4304715182 56 (41-28B) RED WASH NENE 28 T17s R23E WIW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu02148 4304715183 57 (12-18C) RED WASH SWNW 18717 7s R24E POW CHEVRON U § A INCORPORATED
uTU082 4304716477 59 (12-24B) RED WASH SWNW 24 7 78 R23E WIW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu0S67 4304716482 6 (41-21B) RED WASH NENE 217 7s R23E WIW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
yTU02025 4304715184 60 (43-30B) RED WASH NESE 3077s R23E TA CHEVRON U § A INCORPORATED



a“

Page No. 5
02704700

Well Status Report

Utah State Office

Bureau of Land Management

Lease Api Number Well Name QTR Section Township Range Well Status Operator
UTU0559 4304731581 293 (22-22A) RED WAS SENW 22 178 R22E 0SI CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu02148 4304731582 294 (24-18C) RED WAS SESW 18 T 78 R24E PGW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTuos1 4304?31577 295 (11-22B) RED WAS NWNW 2 T7S R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTU0566 4304731578 296 (12-35B) RED WAS SWNW 35717s R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTU81 4304731579 297 (24-15B) RED WAS SESW 15778 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTuoS66 4304731679 298 (22-278) RED WAS SENW 27 1 78 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTuo116 4304733018 299 SWNE 18 778 R23E  POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
utuo82 4304715136 3 (34-23B) RED WASH SWSE 23 T 7S R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTuo81 4304715157 30 (23-13B) RED WASH NESW 13178 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTUO81 4304731682 301 (43-15B) RED WAS NESE 1517s R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTu82 4304731683 302 (22-24B) RED WAS SENW 26 T 78 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
utua116 4304731819 303 (34-17B) RED WAS SWSE 177178 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTU0830 4304732538 305 NENE 4 T 8S R24E PGW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTU093 4304732629 306 NESW 23 T 78 R24E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED

SHHE————bF A FE 2623 GG PSR 24 ABD ——————CHEVRON S A INCORPORATED—

uTU81 4304715158 31 (34-22B) RED WASH SWSE 2178 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED

YFSLOF 1965 b BOLTBRERE—F e

e SESH 29— TS~ R24E—ABD———CHEVRON-U~S—A—THCORPORATED—

uTU081 4304715160 33 (14-14B) RED WASH SWSW 14178 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED

UTU081 4304715161 34 (23-14B) RED WASH NESW 14 17 7S R23E WIW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED

uTu081 4304715162 35 (43-13B) RED WASH NESE 13T1T7s R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
T USA

yTuos1 4304715163 36 (32-138) RED WASH SWNE 1317 R23E POW CHEVRON INCORPORATED

UTU082 4304715165 38 (14-23B) RED WASH SWSW 237178 R23E  POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTU0561 4304715166 39 (14-24A) RED WASH SWSW 24 T 7s R22E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTU081 4304715137 &4 (41-22B) RED WASH NENE 22 T 7s R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTuo82 4304715167 40 (21-24B) RED WASH NENW 24 T 7S R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTU081 4304715168 41 (34-13B) RED WASH SWSE 13717 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTSLO71965 4304715169 42 (21-29C) RED WASH NENW 2971 7S R24E PGW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
- UTU0116 4304715170 43 (12-17B) RED WASH SWNW 17717 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTU0829 4304715171 44 (32-33C) RED WASH SWNE 33717S R24E  PGW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTU02030 4304715172 45 (23-30B) RED WASH NESW 30778 R2ZE TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
yTU080 4304715173 46 (41-21C) RED WASH NENE 217178 R24E PGW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTU02030 4304715174 48 (32-19B) RED WASH SWNE 1977 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTU02025 4304715175 49 (12-29B) RED WASH SWNW 29T 78 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTU082 4304715138 5 (41-23B) RED WASH NENE 237178 R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTU0559 4304715176 50 (14-23A) RED WASH SWSW 237178 R22E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
STATE 4304715177 51 (12-168) RED WASH SWNW 16717s R23E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTUD116 4304715178 52 (14-188) 'RED WASH SWSW 1817 R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTU0561 4304715179 53 (41-25A) RED WASH NENE 257178 R22E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
—HFHES 5Pl I OA TS5 R A —RED—WASH-NENE———24—F—T78——RERE—P+A———CHEVRON-U-S-A—INCORPORATED——
UTU02030 4304715182 56 (41-28B) RED WASH NENE 287178 R23E WIW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
UTU02148 4304715183 57 (12-18C) RED WASH SWNW 187178 R24E POW CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED
uTUo82 4304716477 59 (12-24B) RED WASH SWNW 241778 R23E WIW CHEVRON U § A INCORPORATED
UTU0567 4304716482 6 (41-21B) RED WASH NENE 20178 R23E WIW CHEVRON U § A INCORPORATED

uyTU02025 4304715184 60 (43-30B) RED WASH NESE 30T 7s R23E TA CHEVRON U S A INCORPORATED



Form 3160-5‘ UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
~tJune 1990) ARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ' Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
B&EAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993
S. Lease Designation and Serial No,
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-081
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals - IFIndian, Allottee or Tribe Name
N/A
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE 7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation
I.  Type of Well RED WASH UNIT
it Gas
well D Well D Other 5 Well Name and No,
RED WASH UNIT 30 23-13B

2. Name of Operator

SHENANDOAH ENERGY, INC - AP[Well No.
3. Address and Telephone No 43-047-15157

11002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 (801) 781-4300 10, Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) RED WASH - GREEN RIVER

11. County or Parish, State

1880' FSL &z 1923' FWL (NE SW) SECTION 13, T75, R23E, SLBM UINTAH, UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION - TYPE OF ACTION

Abandonment Change of Plans

D Notice of Intent

Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing
Casing Repair Water Shut-Off
Altering Casing Conversion to Injection

D Final Abandonment Notice

EI:IE]EI[:IEI
HOoOonon

Dispose Water

Other  TA STATUS FOR WELL

(Note) Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13, Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)

WE REQUEST A TA STATUS APPROVAL FOR THIS WELL.

WE BELIEVE A RETURN TO PRODUCTION COULD BE JUSTIFIED IN THE FUTURE.

RECEIVED

APR 17 2000

DIVISION OF
= OIL, GAS AND MINING

14, I hereby certify that the foregomg ls'ime and correct.

Signed D, C, BEAMAN Hﬂ W Tile  QFFICE MANAGER Date 04/13/00

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Approved by: Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any

shelBx ; T Y : S'any falsé, atements or )
”i'&“&‘é'é’fiiif%ﬁ"é’é“éé&?ﬁ"'ﬁdi"siiﬁ‘l"s"s 3, provnde the DlVlSlOll of 011, Gas & Mmmg a Showmg Utah fvision of
of Good Cause as to why this well should 1ot be plugged. __— V. Hepertson GG Mg

struction on neverse olae COP{ 0 oF ERPJOR
Date: 7000
inificls:
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~ Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

. ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH 4-KAS
2.CDW# SN /|
3JLT 6-FILE
Enter date after each listed item is completed
X Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent
Operator Name Change (Only) Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 01-01-2000
FROM: (O1d Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
CHEVRON USA INC SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC
Address: 11002 E. 17500 S. Address: 11002 E. 17500 S.
VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 VERNAL, UT 84078
Phone: 1-(435)-781-4300 Phone: 1-(435)-781-4300
Account No. NO210 Account N4235
CA No. Unit: RED WASH
WELL(S)
API ENTITY SEC.TWN LEASE WELL WELL
NAME NO. NO. RNG TYPE TYPE STATUS
RWU 293 (22-22A) 43-047-31581 {5670 22-07S-22E |FEDERAL [OW TA
RWU 30 (23-13B) 43-047-15157 [5670 13-07S-23E [FEDERAL [GW TA
RWU 297 (24-15B) 43-047-31579 |5670 15-07S-23E |FEDERAL [OW P
RWU 301 (43-15B) 43-047-31682 {5670 15-07S-23E |FEDERAL [GW P
RWU 303 (34-17B) 43-047-31819 [5670 17-07S-23E |FEDERAL |[OW P
RWU 299 (32-18B) 43-047-33018 {5670 18-07S-23E |FEDERAL |OW P
RWU 295 (11-22B) 43-047-31577 |5670 22-07S-23E |FEDERAL |GW S
RWU 31 (34-22B) 43-047-15158 5670 22-07S-23E |FEDERAL |[OW P
RWU 290 (12X-23B) 43-047-31515 [5670 23-07S-23E |FEDERAL |OW PA
RWU 291 (22X-23B) 43-047-31516 {5670 23-07S-23E |[FEDERAL |[OW PA
RWU 29 (32-23B) 43-047-15156 |5670 23-07S-23E [FEDERAL [OW P
RWU 292 (42-23B) 43-047-31576 [5670 23-07S8-23E |FEDERAL [GW TA
RWU 3 (34-23B) 43-047-15136 5670 23-07S-23E |FEDERAL [OW P
RWU 289 (13-24B) 43-047-31517 [5670 24-07S-23E |FEDERAL |OW P
RWU 302 (22-24B) 43-047-31683 5670 24-07S-23E |[FEDERAL |GW S
RWU 298 (22-27B) 43-047-31679 5670 27-07S-23E |[FEDERAL [OW TA
RWU 296 (12-35B) 43-047-31578 15670 35-07S-23E |[FEDERAL [OW P
RWU 307 43-047-32632 5670 16-07S-24E |STATE |GW PA
RWU 294 (24-18C) 43-047-31582 5670 18-07S-24E |FEDERAL |{GW P
RWU 306 43-047-32629 |5670 23-07S-24E |[FEDERAL |GW P
RWU 308 43-047-32627 [5670 28-07S-24E |FEDERAL [GW PA
RWU 305 (41-4F) 43-047-32538 [5670 04-08S-24E |FEDERAL |GW TA
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 12-30-1999
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 08-09-2000
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£

3. The new company has been checked throgthe Department of Commerce, Division of onrations Database on: 08-23-2000 "

4. s the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 224885

5. IfNO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: 02/04/2000

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator

for wells listed on: 02/04/2000
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA'"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Pro; The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,

for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 09/20/2000
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 09/20/2000
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: N/A
4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: N/A

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: 159261960

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:

1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed has furnished a bond: N/A
2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on:

FILMING:
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on: (53 foq/ o /

FILING:
1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:

COMMENTS:




. .estar Exploration and Production Company
= ependence Plaza .
- 1050 17th Street, Suite 500

Denver, CO 80265
Tel 303 672 6900 « Fax 303 294 9632

Denver Division

May 28, 2003

Division of Oil, Gas, & Mining

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P. O. Box 145801

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Attention: John Baza/Jim Thompson

Gentlemen:

This will setve as notice that through the internal corporate changes described below,
activities formetly conducted in the name of either Shenandoah Operating Company, LLC
(SOC) and/or Shenandoah Enetgy, Inc. (SEI) will hereafter be conducted in the name of
QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.: i) the Shenandoah entities wete purchased in July, 2001 by Questar
Market Resources, Inc., which is a mid-level holding company for the non-utility businesses
of Questar Corporation, ii) Shenandoah Operating Company, LL.C has now been merged
into Shenandoah Enetgy, Inc. (SEI), iii) Shenandoah Energy, Inc. has now been re-named
QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. putsuant to a State of Delaware Amended and Restated Certificate
of Incotporation, iv) the same employees will continue to be responsible for operations of
the former SOC and SEI properties, both in the field and in the office. Accordingly, the
change involves only an internal corporate name change and no third party change of
operatot is involved. Please alter your tecords to reflect the entity name change. Attached is
a spreadsheet listing all wells affected by this change.

Should you have any questions, please call me at 303 - 308-3056.

Yours truly,

rank Nielsen
Division Landman
Enclosure " ECEIVED
JUN 2 2003

DIVCOF OIL, GAS & MINING



SEl (N4235) to QEP (N2460) RED WASH UNIT

sl

well_name Sec |T R api Lease Type type |stat
RED WASH 22-21B 21 10705 [230E (4304733522 5670{Federal OW |TA
RED WASH 24-20B 20 |070S |[230E 4304733523 5670|Federal oW [P
RED WASH 305 (41-4F) 04 [080S |{240E [4304732538 5670|Federal GW (TA
RED WASH 306 23 |070S |240E (4304732629 5670|Federal GW [P
RED WASH 44-19B 19 |070S |230E [4304733524 5670 |Federal ow [P
RED WASH 44-20B 20 |070S |[230E 14304733525 5670|Federal oW [P
RWU | (41-26B) 26 [070S |230E [4304715135 5670|Federal OW |TA
RWU 10 (12-23B) 23 {070S |230E {4304715141 5670 |Federal OW |TA
RWU 101 (34-21B) 21 |070S [230E |4304715220 5670 |Federal oW (P
RWU 103 (34-15B) 15 |070S |230E {4304715222 5670|Federal ow [P
RWU 108 (32-21B) 21 |070S |230E (4304715226 5670 |Federal ow [P
RWU 109 (21-28B) 28 [070S {230E 4304715227 5670|Federal oW |P
RWU 110(23-23A) 23 1070S [220E 4304715228 5670|Federal ow (P
RWU 111 (32-24A) 24 1070S [220E [4304715229 5670|Federal OW TA
RWU 112 (32-28A) 28 |070S {220E 4304715230 5670 |Federal ow |P
RWU 115 (21-19B) 19 [070S ([230E 4304715233 5670 Federal ow |P
RWU 119 (43-29A) 29 |070S |220E (4304715236 5670|Federal ow [P
RWU 120 (23-28B) 28 |070S |230E [4304715237 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 121 (13-13B) 13 [070S [230E 4304715238 5670 |Federal GW |P
RWU 122 (24-14B) 14 |070S |230E (4304715239 5670 |Federal oW (P
RWU 125 (34-19B) 19 [070S |[230E |4304715242 5670 {Federal OW |TA
RWU 126 (41-29A) 29 |070S |220E [4304715243 5670{Federal ow |P
RWU 127 (12-19B) 19 10708 {230E 14304715244 5670 |Federal oW [TA
RWU 129 (14-15B) 15 |070S |230E 14304715246 5670{Federal oW (P
RWU 13 (14-22B) 22 |070S [230E (4304715143 5670|Federal OwW |[TA
RWU 133 (41-34B) 34 [070S [230E (4304715250 5670|Federal OwW (P
RWU 136 (43-19B) 19 1070S [230E (4304715252 5670|Federal OW |TA
RWU 137 (34-28B) 28 |070S |230E {4304715253 5670Federal GW |[TA
RWU 138 (41-30B) 30 |070S {230E (4304715254 5670 |Federal ow [P
RWU 140 (24-22B) 22 |070S |230E (4304715255 5670 |Federal oW [P
RWU 141 (11-27B) 27 |070S |230E (4304715256 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 143 (33-14B) 14 {0708 |[230E [4304715257 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 144 (21-18B) 18 [070S |230E |4304715258 5670(Federal OW |ITA
RWU 145 (24-13B) 13 [070S {230E 14304715259 5670{Federal oW (TA
RWU 147 (22-22B) 22 [070S |230E {4304715260 5670{Federal oW (TA
RWU 15 (32-17C) 17 |070S 1240E (4304715145 5670{Federal ow (P
RWU 151 (42-14B) 14 |070S |[230E |4304715264 5670 |Federal ow |P
RWU 153 (14-29B) 29 1070S [230E (4304715265 5670 |Federal oW |P
RWU 158 (32-30B) 30 {070S [230E [4304715268 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 160 (32-15B) 15 1070S |230E |4304715270 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 162 (12-20B) 20 [070S |230E |4304715272 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 164 (12-28B) 28 [070S (230E 14304715274 5670|Federal ow ([P
RWU 165 (32-26B) 26 [070S 230E 14304715275 5670|Federal GW |TA
RWU 167 (23-21B) 21 [070S {230E (4304715277 5670|Federal oW IS
RWU 168 (23-24B) 24 1070S (230E 14304715278 5670{Federal oW |TA
RWU 172 (21-30B) 30 |070S [230E (4304715280 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 176 (31-28B) 28 10708 [230E (4304715283 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 177 (42-28B) 28 {070S [230E (4304715284 5670 |Federal OW |TA
RWU 178 (22-13B) 13 {070S |230E |4304715285 5670 |Federal OW TA
RWU 180 (31-23B) 23  |070S |230E (4304715287 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 181 (34-30B) 30 ]070S |230E |4304715288 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 184 (23-26B) 26 [070S [230E [4304715290 5670|Federal oW [TA
RWU 188 (23-20B) 20 [070S |230E [4304715291 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 19 (34-26B) 26 [070S |230E [4304715148 5670|Federal GW |TA
RWU 192 (41-33A) 33 [070S |220E 14304715294 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 193 (43-24B) 24 |070S |230E {4304715295 5670|Federal GW (S
RWU 194 (12-14B) 14 |070S |230E (4304715296 5670{Federal ow S
RWU 196 (23-17C) 17 1070S |240E (4304715298 5670|Federal GW |S
RWU 201 (32-28C) 28 [070S [240E ]4304715302 5670 {Federal GW [P
RWU 204 (23-25A) 25 [070S |220E (4304715305 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 205 (23-21C) 21 [070S [240E 14304715306 5670|Federal GW |TA
RWU 207 17 ]070S {230E }4304732738 5670|Federal oW |P
RWU 21 (32-14B) 14 |070S [230E (4304715150 5670|Federal ow (P
RWU 212 (41-8F) 08 |080S [240E [4304720014 5670|Federal GW [P
RWU 21-24A 24 |070S [220E (4304733592 5670{Federal oW |P

0&g db sorted

1

8/28/2003



SEI (N4235) to QEP (N2460) RED WASH UNIT

well_name t Sec |T R api Entit’ Lease Type  |type [stat
RWU 21-25A 25 |070S [220E 14304733576 5670{Federal ow |P
RWU 219 (44-21C) 21 |070S {240E |4304730149 5670{Federal GW (P
RWU 220 (22-23B) 23 |070S |230E 4304730192 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 221 (13-27B) 27 |070S |230E [4304730199 5670|Federal oW [TA
RWU 22-13A 13 |070S |220E [4304733765 5670|Federal ow |S
RWU 22-19B 19 |070S [230E 4304733559 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 222 (31-27B) 27 {0708 (230E [4304730200 5670{Federal GW |TA
RWU 22-20B 20 [070S [230E [4304733491 5670|Federal ow P
RWU 22-25A 25 |070S |220E 14304733786 5670 |Federal ow |P
RWU 22-29B 29 10708 [230E 4304733766 5670{Federal ow IS
RWU 224 (44-22B) 22 {070S [230E (4304730202 5670|Federal GW [TA
RWU 225 (13-23B) 23 |070S |230E (4304730212 5670|Federal GW (TA
RWU 226 (24-23B) 23 1070S [230E |4304730249 5670{Federal GW IS
RWU 227 (14-26B) 26 |070S [230E 4304730257 5670|Federal oW ITA
RWU 228 (21-34B) 34 [070S |230E [4304730258 5670(Federal ow |P
RWU 229 (43-26B) 26 |070S {230E {4304730259 5670{Federal oW |TA
RWU 230 (14-180) 18 {070S [240E |4304730309 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 231 (21-35B) 35 [070S |230E 4304730310 5670(Federal oW [TA
RWU 232 (12-26B) 26 |070S [230E (4304730311 5670|Federal oW [TA
RWU 23-24A 24 |070S |220E {4304733567 5670(Federal oW P
RWU 233 (12-25B) 25 {070S |[230E 4304730312 5670 |Federal oW ITA
RWU 234 (32-24B) 24 1070S |230E [4304730313 5670{Federal OwW [P
RWU 235 (34-18C) 18 1070S [240E 14304730314 5670 |Federal ow |P
RWU 236 (21-19C) 19 10708 [240E 4304730340 5670|Federal GW |P
RWU 237 (14-25B) 25 10708 [230E 14304730341 - 5670]|Federal ow [P
RWU 238 (32-35B) 35 1070S 1230E |4304730342 5670|Federal oW ITA
RWU 239 (41-35B) 35 10708 |230E |4304730343 5670|Federal OW TA
RWU 24 (34-14B) 14 10708 [230E 14304715152 5670|Federal oW [P
RWU 240 (12-36B) 36 |070S |230E {4304730344 5670|Federal OwW (P
RWU 241 (22-14B) 14 {0708 [230E (4304730345 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 24-18B 18 |070S {230E (4304733554 5670|Federal ow [P
RWU 24-19B 19 1070S [230E (4304733492 5670|Federal owW |P
RWU 242 (42-13B) 13 1070S [230E 14304730346 5670{Federal ow |P
RWU 243 (42-18C) 18 [070S |240E 14304730347 5670{Federal oW |TA
RWU 244 (23-19C) 19 |070S [240E 4304730348 5670Federal GW P
RWU 246 (22-18C) 18 |070S |240E 4304730387 5670|Federal ow [P
RWU 247 (22-17C) 17 {0708 [240E 4304730388 5670(Federal GW [P
RWU 26 (23-22B) 22 1070S |230E 4304715153 5670|Federal oW [TA
RWU 262 (22-26B) 26 |070S |230E |4304730517 5670|Federal GW |TA
RWU 265 (44-26B) 26 [070S [230E |4304730520 5670|Federal GW [P
RWU 267 (32-17B) 17 10708 [230E |4304732981 5670 |Federal ow [P
RWU 27 (43-14B) 14 |070S [230E |4304715154 5670 Federal oW |TA
RWU 270 (22-35B) 35 |070S |230E 4304731082 5670|Federal ow _|P
RWU 272 (44-23B) 23 |070S {230E 4304731054 5670|Federal GW |P
RWU 273 (42-27B) 27 {0708 j230E [4304731051 5670|Federal Oow |TA
RWU 276 (44-27B) 27 10708 {230E {4304731053 5670(Federal oW ITA
RWU 278 (11-26) 26 {0705 |230E 4304731076 5670|Federal GW |TA
RWU 28 (43-22B) 22 |1070S |230E |4304715155 5670|Federal ow [P
RWU 280 (11-35B) 35 10708 |230E 4304731079 5670(Federal ow [P
RWU 282 (42-26B) 26 |070S [230E [4304731080 5670{Federal GW ({TA
RWU 284 (33-23B) 23 |070S |230E 4304731476 5670|Federal GW |TA
RWU 285 (11-24B) 24 [070S [230E (4304731477 5670]Federal oW (P
RWU 286 (42-21B) 21 ]070S |230E |4304731478 5670 Federal oW P
RWU 287 (44-13B) 13 |070S [230E 4304731512 5670 Federal oW (TA
RWU 288 (24-27) 27 |070S |230E |4304731513 5670 {Federal oW TA
RWU 289 (13-24B) 24 10708 [230E [4304731517 5670{Federal ow [P
RWU 29 (32-23B) 23 |070S {230E 4304715156 5670{Federal ow [P
RWU 292 (42-23B) 23 |070S [230E [4304731576 5670|Federal GW |TA
RWU 293 (22-22A) 22 |070S |220E 4304731581 5670|Federal ow |TA
RWU 294 (24-18C) 18 |070S [240E 4304731582 5670(Federal GW |P
RWU 295 (11-22B) 22 |070S [230E 4304731577 5670(Federal GW |TA
RWU 296 (12-35B) 35 (0708 |230E |4304731578 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 297 (24-15B) 15 [070S [230E 4304731579 5670(Federal ow (P
RWU 298 (22-27B) 27 10708 {230E [4304731679 5670{Federal oW |TA
RWU 299 (32-18B) 18 [070S [230E 4304733018 5670{Federal ow (P

o&g db sorted 2 8/28/2003



SEI (N4235) to QEP (N2460) RED WASH UNIT .

well_name ‘ Sec |T R api Enu't):t iLease Type  itype |[stat
RWU 3 (34-23B) 23 |070S |{230E (4304715136 5670|Federal oW (P
RWU 30 (23-13B) 13 1070S (230E 14304715157 5670 Federal GW |TA
RWU 301 (43-15B) 15 |070S |230E 14304731682 5670|Federal GW |S
RWU 302 (22-24B) 24 |070S [230E {4304731683 5670|Federal GW |TA
RWU 303 (34-17B) 17 (0708 |230E {4304731819 5670|Federal oW [P
RWU 31 (34-22B) 22 1070S |230E {4304715158 5670|Federal oW |P
RWU 33 (14-14B) 14 |070S |230E 4304715160 56701Federal GW [TA
RWU 35 (43-13B) 13 |070S |230E {4304715162 5670 Federal oW [TA
RWU 36 (32-13B) 13 |070S |230E 14304715163 56701Federal GW |P
RWU 38 (14-23B) 23 |070S |230E (4304715165 5670|Federal ow [P
RWU 39 (14-24A) 24 {070S ]220E (4304715166 5670 (Federal oW |[TA
RWU 4 (41-22B) 22 {070S {230E (4304715137 5670{Federal oW |TA
RWU 40 (21-24B) 24 |070S |[230E (4304715167 5670|Federal oW [TA
RWU 41 (34-13B) 13 }070S [230E {4304715168 5670|Federal oW |P
RWU 41-24A 24 |070S |[220E 14304733769 5670|Federal oW P
RWU 41-25A 25 1070S |220E 14304733579 5670|Federal oW |P
RWU 42 (21-29C) 29 |070S |240E (4304715169 5670|Federal GW [P
RWU 42-19B 19 |070S [230E [4304733556 5670 |Federal ow [P
RWU 42-20B 20. {070S |230E (4304733490 5670|Federal oW |P
RWU 42-24A 24 0708 {220E 14304733569 5670 |Federal oW |P
RWU 42-25A 25 |070S |[220E |4304733580 5670 (Federal oW |S
RWU 42-30B 30 {070S [230E (4304733771 5670|Federal oW [P
RWU 43 (12-17B) 17 10708 |230E }4304715170 5670|Federal oW |P
RWU 44 (32-33C) 33 |070S [240E [4304715171 5670|Federal GW [P
RWU 44-18B 18 |070S [230E (4304733594 5670 |Federal oW |P
RWU 44-30B 30 [070S {230E {4304733772 5670 |Federal oW [P
RWU 45 (23-30B) 30 |070S [230E (4304715172 5670|Federal oW [TA
RWU 46 (41-21C) 21 1070S [240E [4304715173 5670|Federal GW |TA
RWU 49 (12-29B) 29 {070S {230E (4304715175 5670{Federal OW TA .
RWU 5 (41-23B) 23 |070S |230E (4304715138 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 50 (14-23A) 23 |070S [220E {4304715176 5670|Federal oW [P
RWU 52 (14-18B) 18 {070S [230E {4304715178 5670|Federal oW |[TA
RWU 53 (41-25A) 25 {0708 {220E 14304715179 5670|Federal OW |(TA
RWU 57 (12-18C) 18 [070S |240E 14304715183 5670|Federal ow [P
RWU 63 (21-22B) 22 |070S |[230E (4304715186 5670 |Federal GW |[TA
RWU 64 (32-27B) 27 |070S |230E [4304715187 5670|Federal OW |TA
RWU 66 (34-18B) 18 10708 {230E |4304715189 5670|Federal oW |P
RWU 67 (42-22B) 22 |070S |230E {4304715190 5670{Federal OW [TA
RWU 69 (21-27B) 27 |070S [230E [4304715191 5670 |Federal oW [TA
RWU 70 (23-22A) 22 {070S |220E 14304715192 5670{Federal ow (P
RWU 71 (21-18C) 18 {070S {240E [4304715193 5670|Federal oW [P
RWU 72 (23-27B) 27 10708 [230E {4304715194 5670{Federal oW |{TA
RWU 74 (12-13B) 13 [070S |230E 4304715196 5670 Federal GW [P
RWU 75 (21-26B) 26 |070S |[230E (4304715197 5670|Federal oW |TA
RWU 76 (32-18C) 18 [070S [240E (4304715198 5670|Federal GW |8
RWU 77 (21-13B) 13 1070S {230E (4304715199 5670 Federal oW [P
RWU 78 (32-28B) 28 [070S [230E 14304715200 5670{Federal ow (P
RWU 79 (12-27B) 27 [070S [230E [4304715201 5670|Federal OW |TA
RWU 8 (32-22B) 22 |070S |230E (4304715139 5670|Federal oW [P
RWU 80 (14-27B) 27 1070S [230E [4304715202 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 81 (41-31B) 31 {070S |230E [4304715203 5670|Federal oW |P
RWU 83 (41-27A) 27 {070S |220E (4304715205 5670|Federal ow |P
RWU 84 (44-14B) 14 [070S |230E (4304715206 5670{Federal GW [P
RWU 9 (43-23B) 23 {0708 |230E (4304715140 5670|Federal oW (P
RWU 90 (43-21B) 21 10708 [230E (4304715211 5670|Federal oW [P
RWU 92 (11-23B) 23 10708 [230E (4304715212 5670|Federal oW [TA
RWU 94 (12-22A) 22 1070S [220E |4304715213 5670|Federal ow [P
RWU 99 (12-22B) 22 [070S |230E 4304715218 5670{Federal oW [P
RED WASH UNIT 259 16 [070S [230E (4304732785 5670|State OW [P
RED WASH UNIT 260 16 {0708 [230E (4304732786 5670|State oW P
RWU 51 (12-16B) 16 {0708 |230E [4304715177 5670|State oW [P
RWU ST 189 (41-16B) 16 |070S |230E (4304715292 5670]State ow [P
RED WASH UNIT 261 17 {070S {230E (4304732739 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 100-A (43-21A) 21 {070S |220E [4304715219 5670 |Federal Wl |A
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SEI (N4235) to QEP (N2460) RED WASH UNIT

well_name Sec |T R api Lease Type type |[stat
RWU 102 (41-24A) 24 |070S |220E [4304715221 5670{Federal Wl A
RWU 11 27 |070S [230E [4304715142 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 11-19B 19 |070S {230E {4304733552 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 11-20B 20 1070S |230E 4304733553 5670{Federal Wl |A
RWU 11-25A 25 1070S |220E (4304733574 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 11-29B 29 [070S [230E 4304733590 5670|Federal Wl {A
RWU 11-30B 30 (070S |230E {4304733785 5670{Federal Wl A
RWU 12-24A 24 10708 [220E {4304733591 5670|Federal Wi |A
RWU 13-19B 19 |070S [230E ]4304733497 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 13-20B 20 {070S |[230E [4304733498 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 13-25A 25 |070S |[220E 4304733575 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 14 (14-13B) 13 |070S |230E (4304715144 5670{Federal Wl A
RWU 148 (13-22B) 22 [070S [230E |4304715261 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 150 (31-22B) 22 |070S |[230E 4304715263 5670|Federal WL |l
RWU 156 (23-15B) 15 1070S [230E 4304715267 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 16 (43-28B) 28 |070S {230E 14304716475 5670{Federal wI |1
RWU 161 (14-20B) 20 1070S |230E (4304715271 5670|Federal wi |l
RWU 17 (41-20B) 20 |070S |230E (4304715146 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 170 (41-15B) 15 10708 (230E |4304716495 5670|Federal Wl |l
RWU 173 (21-21B) 21 {070S {230E {4304716496 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 174 (21-20B) 20 ]070S |230E [4304715281 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 182 (14-21B) 21 1070S |230E (4304716497 5670|{Federal Wl A
RWU 183 (33-13B) 13 |070S |230E 4304715289 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 185 (41-1B) 14 |070S [230E |4304716498 5670{Federal Wl |A
RWU 199 (43-22A) 22 {070S [220E (4304715301 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 2 (14-24B) 24 10708 230E (4304716472 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 202 (21-34A) 34 [070S [220E (4304715303 5670|Federal ‘!
RWU 213 (41-33B) 33 [070S |[230E 14304720060 5670{Federal WD A
RWU 215 (43-28A) 28 [070S [220E (4304730058 5670{Federal Wl |A
RWU 216 (21-27A) 27 [070S [220E (4304730103 5670{Federal Wl A
RWU 23 (21-23B) 23 [070S [230E 4304715151 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 23-18C (97) 18 |070S [240E |4304715216 5670|Federal Wl I
RWU 25 (23-23B) 23 |070S {230E [4304716476 5670|Federal Wi |A
RWU 258 (34-22A) 22 1070S 1220E |4304730458 5670|Federal wl  |A
RWU 263 (24-26B) 26 {070S |230E [4304730518 5670|Federal Wl |I
RWU 264 (31-35B) 35 {070S [230E (4304730519 5670(Federal Wl |A
RWU 266 (33-26B) 26 {070S [230E [4304730521 5670|Federal WI |1
RWU 268 (43-17B) 17 1070S [230E 14304732980 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 269 (13-26B) 26 [070S [230E {4304730522 5670|Federal Wl |I
RWU 271 (42-35B) 35 10708 |230E 14304731081 5670|Federal Wl |l
RWU 275 (31-26B) 26 1070S 1230E 14304731077 5670|Federal WI (A
RWU 279 (11-36B) 36 1070S {230E [4304731052 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 283 (43-18B) 18 |070S {230E (4304732982 5670{Federal Wl |A
RWU 31-19B 19 1070S |230E (4304733555 5670{Federal Wl (A
RWU 31-25A 25 {0708 |220E (4304733577 5670{Federal Wl A
RWU 31-30B 30 {070S [230E (4304733788 5670iFederal WI  |A
RWU 33-19B 19 {070S |[230E (4304733499 5670{Federal Wl |A
RWU 33-20B 20 [070S |230E (4304733500 5670{Federal Wl |A
RWU 33-25A 25 |070S |220E (4304733578 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 33-30B 30 ]070S |230E |4304733790 5670|Federal Wl (A
RWU 34 (23-14B) 14 |070S [230E (4304715161 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 34-13A 13 1070S [220E [4304733593 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 34-24A 24 |070S |[220E (4304733568 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 48 (32-19B) 19 |070S [230E [4304715174 5670|Federal Wl I
RWU 56 (41-28B) 28 [070S [230E (4304715182 5670|Federal Wl A
RWU 59 (12-24B) 24 [070S |230E 14304716477 5670|Federal Wl (A
RWU 6 (41-21B) 21 [070S |230E 14304716482 5670|Federal Wl (A
RWU 61 (12-27A) 27 1070S {220E i4304716478 5670|Federal Wl |I
RWU 68 (41-13B) 13 j070S |230E 14304716485 5670|Federal Wl (I
RWU 7 (41-27B) 27 1070S |230E |4304716473 5670|Federal WwI |1
RWU 88 (23-18B) 18 {070S |230E [4304715210 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 91 (33-22B) 22 {070S |230E 4304716479 5670|Federal Wl |A
RWU 93 (43-27B) 27 [070S [230E (4304716480 5670|Federal Wl |l
RWU 324 (23-16B) 16 [070S |230E |4304733084 5670{State Wi [
4
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United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
UT-922

June 9, 2003

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
1050 17" Street, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265

Re: Red Wash Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentiemen:

On May 30, 2003, we received an indenture dated February 1, 2003, whereby Shenandoah Energy,
Inc. changed it name and QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. was designated as Successor Unit Operator for the
Red Wash Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effective June 9, 2003.
In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the
designated party has obtained all required approval that would entitle it to conduct operations under
Red Wash Unit Agreement.

Your nationwide (Eastern States) oil and gas bond No. B000024 will be used to cover all operations
within the Red Wash Unit.

It is requested that you notify all interested parties of the name change of unit operator. Copies of
the approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriate federal offices, with one copy
returned herewith.

Sincerely,
/s/ Robert A. Henricks

Robert A. Henricks
Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure
bee:  Field Manager - Vernal (w/enclosure)
SITLA

Division of Qil, Gas & Mining

Minerals Adjudication Group

File — Red Wash Unit (w/enclosure)

Agr. Sec. Chron

Fluid Chron
UT922:TAThompson:tt:6/9/03



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET

Change of Operator (Well Sold)

ROUTING

1. GLH"

2. CDW

3. FILE

Designation of Agent/Operator

X Operator Name Change Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 2/1/2003
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N4235-Shenandoah Energy Inc N2460-QEP Uinta Basin Inc
11002 E 17500 S 11002 E 17500 S

Vernal, UT 84078-8526 Vernal, UT 84078-8526

Phone: (435) 781-4341 Phone: (435) 781-4341
CA No. Unit: RED WASH
WELL(S)
NAME SECITWN |RNG|API NO ENTITY |LEASE |WELL {WELL [co"
' NO TYPE |TYPE | STATUS

RWU 293 (22-22A) 22 |070S {220E{4304731581 5670|Federal |OW TA
RWU 30 (23-13B) 13 10708 |230E (4304715157 5670|Federal |GW TA
RWU 35 (43-13B) 13 1070S [230E (4304715162 5670{Federal |[OW TA
RWU 36 (32-13B) 13 {070S |230E|4304715163 5670|Federal |GW P
RWU 33 (14-14B) 14 1070S [230E}4304715160 | 5670|Federal |GW TA
RWU 297 (24-15B) 15 |070S |230E{4304731579 5670|Federal |OW P
RWU 301 (43-15B) 15 |070S [230E|4304731682 5670/Federal |GW S
RWU 303 (34-17B) 17 10708 [{230E}4304731819 5670{Federal |OW P
RWU 299 (32-18B) 18 {070S {230E|4304733018 5670|Federal |OW P
RWU 295 (11-22B) 22 |070S |230E|4304731577 5670|Federal |GW TA
RWU 31 (34-22B) 22 {070S [230E|4304715158 5670|Federal |OW P
RWU 29 (32-23B) 23 [070S |230E (4304715156 5670|Federal |OW P
RWU 292 (42-23B) 23 1070S [230E|4304731576 5670|Federal |GW TA
RWU 3 (34-23B) 23 {070S |230E{4304715136 5670|Federal |OW P
RWU 38 (14-23B) 23 |070S §230E|4304715165 5670|Federal |OW p
RWU 289 (13-24B) 24 1070S j230E|4304731517 5670{Federal |OW P
RWU 302 (22-24B) 24 1070S {230E{4304731683 5670|Federal |GW TA
RWU 298 (22-27B) 27 [070S |230E{4304731679 5670{Federal [OW TA
RWU 296 (12-35B) 35 J070S |230E 4304731578 5670|Federal |OW P
RWU 294 (24-18C) 18 |070S j240E14304731582 5670|Federal |GW P
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2003
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on:  6/2/2003
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/19/2003

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah:

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

YES Business Number:

5292864-0151

QEP UB 19 FORM B.xis




6. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: 7/21/2003

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 7/21/2003

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements (""CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,

for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: n/a
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 8/28/2003
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 8/28/2003
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: n/a
4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: na_ -

STATE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965-003-032

FEDERAL WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024

INDIAN WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 799446

FEE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number  965-003-033

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
The Division sent response by letter on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS:

QEP UB 19 FORM B.xIs



JUL 07 2003
3104 (932.34)WF
Nationwide Bond ESB000024
NOTICE
QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. : Qil and Gas

1050 17 Street Suite 500 : lease
Denver, Colorado 80265 :

Name Change Recognized

Acceptable evidence has been filed in this office concerning the name change of Shenandoah
Energy Incorporated into QEP Uinta Basin, Incorporated. QEP Uinta Basin, Incorporated is the
surviving entity. This name change is recognized effective April 17, 2003.

Eastern States will notify the Minerals Management Service and all applicable Bureau of Land
Management offices of the change by a copy of this notice.

If you identify other leases in which the merging entity maintain an interest, please contact thls
office and we will appropriately document those files with a copy of this notice.

If you have any questions, please contact Bill Forbes at 703-440-1536.

S/L'U(//'.wwL 6 forbes

Wilbert B. Forbes
Land Law Examiner
Branch of Use Authorization
Division of Resources Planning,
Use and Protection ‘

bc: JFO,MMS, ES RF, 930 RF, 932.34 RF, E-932: wbf:07 /07/03:440-1536/ QEP Umta Basin
Mo



Division of Qil, Gas and Mining

ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1.DJJ
2. CDW
Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 1/1/2007
FROM: (0ld Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2460-QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. N5085-Questar E&P Company
1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265
Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900 Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900
CA No. Unit: RED WASH UNIT
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG|API NO ENTITY |LEASE TYPE|WELL |WELL
NO TYPE | STATUS
SEE ATTACHED LISTS [ | *
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 4/19/2007
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 4/16/2007
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on:

4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah:

5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on:
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on:

5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on:

1/31/20035

Business Number: 764611-0143

IN PLACE

n/a
n/a

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM

7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on:

4/23/2007 BIA

4/23/2007

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements (""CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on:

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC")

The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on:

DATA ENTRY:

1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007

4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007

5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007

6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: Wa

BOND VERIFICATION:

1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024

2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 799446

3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965003033

3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:

4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on:

n/a

COMMENTS: THIS IS A COMPANY NAME CHANGE.

SOME WELL NAMES HAVE BEEN CHANGED AS REQUESTED

Questar E&P FORM A.xls 4/30/2007 AND 5/15/2007




10f7 QEP Uinta Basin {(N2460) to QUESTAR E and P {N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT
Original Well Name SEC | TWP | RNG AP1 Entity Lease Well Type |Status
|

RWU 1 (41-26B) RW 41-26B 26 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715135 | 5670 Federal |OW |TA
RWU 3 (34-23B) RW 34-23B SWSE 23 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715136 | 5670 Federal |OW P
RWU 4 (41-22B) RW 41-22B NENE 22 | 0708 | 23CE | 4304715137 | 5670 Federal |OW TA
RWU 5 (41-23B) RW 41-23B 'NENE 23 | 0708 | 23C6E = 4304715138 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 8 (32-22B) RW 32-22B SWNE 22 | 070S | 230E | 4304715139 | 5670 Federal |OW P
RWU ¢ (43-23B) RW 43-23B 'NESE 23 | 070S | 230E = 4304715140 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 10 (12-23B}) RW 12-23B [SWNW | 23 | 070S | 230E | 4304715141 | 5670 Federal |OW |TA
RWU 11 RW 34-27B 'SWSE 27 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715142 | 99996 Federal |WI A
RWU 13 (14-22B} RW 14-22B SWSW 22 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715143 | 5670 Federal |OW TA
RW 14-13B RW 14-13B SWSW 13 | 070S | 230E | 4304715144 | 99996 Federal |WI A
RWU 15 (32-17C) RW 32-17C ISWNE | 17 | 0708 | 240E | 4304715145 | 5670 Federal |OW P
RWU 17 (41-20B) RW 41-20B NENE 20 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715146 @ 5670 |Federal |WTI A
RWU 19 (34-26B) RW 34-26B SWSE | 26 | 070S | 230E | 4304715148 | 5670 Federal |GW S
RWU 21 (32-14B) RW 32-14B |SWNE 14 | 070S | 230E | 4304715150 | 5670 Federal |OW _|P
RWU 23 (21-23B) RW 21-23B SENW 23 | 070S | 230E | 4304715151 | 99996 Federal |WI A
RWU 24 (34-14B) RW 34-14B SWSE 14 | 070S | 230E | 4304715152 | 5670 |Federal [OW S
RWU 26 (23-22B) RW 23-22B NESW 22 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715153 | 5670 |Federal OW TA |
RWU 27 (43-14B) RW 43-14B _|INESE 14 | 070S | 230E | 4304715154 | 5670 |Federal [OW TA
RWU 28 (43-22B) RW 43-22B INESE | 22 | 0708 ' 230E | 4304715155 | 5670 |Federal OW B i
RWU 29 (32-23B) RW 32-23B SWNE = 23 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715156 | 5670 |Federal OW P
RW 23-13B RW 23-13B NESW = 13 | 070S | 230E | 4304715157 | 5670 |Federal GW TA
RWU 31 {34-22B) RW 34-22B SWSE 22 | 070S | 230E | 4304715158 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 33 (14-14B) RW 14-14B SWSW 14 | 070S | 230E | 4304715160 | 5670 |Federal GW TA
RWU 34 (23-14B) RW 23-14B NESW 14 | 070S | 230E | 4304715161 | 99996 |Federal |WI A
RW 43-13B RW 43-13B NESE 13 | 070S | 230E | 4304715162 | 5670 |Federal |[OW TA
RWU 36 (32-13B) RW 32-13B ~ ISWNE | 13 | 070S | 230E | 4304715163 | 5670 |Federal |GW P
RWU 38 (14-23B) RW 14-23B SWSW 23 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715165 | 5670 |Federal |[OW P
RWU 39 (14-24A) RW 14-24A SWSwW 24 | 0708 | 220E | 4304715166 | 5670 |Federal |[OW TA
RWU 40 (21-24B) RW 21-24B NENW | 24 | 070S | 230E | 4304715167 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 41 (34-13B) RW 34-13B SWSE : 13 | 070S | 230E | 4304715168 | 5670 |Federal ow P
RWU 42 (21-29C) RW 21-29C NENW 29 | 0708 | 240E | 4304715169 | 5670 |Federal |GW P
RWU 43 (12-17B) RW 12-17B SWNW 17 | 070S | 230E | 4304715170 | 5670 Federal |OW P
RWU 44 (32-33C) RW 32-33C SWNE 33 | 070S | 240F | 4304715171 | 5670 Federal |GW P
RWU 45 (23-30B) RW 23-30B _ |INESW 30 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715172 | 5670 Federal |OW TA Ly
RWU 46 (41-21C) RW 41-21C INENE | 21 | 070S | 240E | 4304715173 | 5670 Federal |GW TA
RWU 48 (32-19B) RW 32-19B SWNE 19 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715174 | 99996 Federal |WI I
RWU 49 (12-29B) RW 12-29B SWNW | 29 | 070S | 230E | 4304715175 | 5670 |Federal |[OW TA
RWU 50 (14-23A) RW 14-23A SWSW 23 | 0708 | 220E | 4304715176 | 3670 |Federal OW P
RWU 52 (14-18B) RW 14-18B SWSW 18 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715178 | 53670 |Federal OW TA
RWU 53 (41-25A) RW 41-25A NENE 25 | 0708 | 220E | 4304715179 | 5670 |Federal OW TA
RWU 56 (41-28B) RW 41-28B NENE 28 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715182 | 99996 |Federal |WI |A




20f7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name 1Q/Q SEC | TWP | RNG API Entity |Lease  |Well Type |Status
RWU 57 (12-18C) |[RW 12-18C SWNW | 18 | 070S | 240E | 4304715183 @ 5670 |Federal OW P

RWU 63 (21-22B) [RW 21-22B NENW | 22 | 070S | 230E | 4304715186 | 35670 |Federal |GW TA
RWU 64 (32-27B) [RW 32-27B SWNE | 27 | 070S | 230E | 4304715187 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 66 (34-18B) 'RW 34-18B SWSE 18 | 070S | 230E | 4304715189 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 67 (42-22B) RW 42-22B SENE | 22 | 070S | 230E | 4304715190 | 5670 |Federal OW TA
RWU 69 (21-27B) RW 21-27B NENW | 27 | 070S | 230E | 4304715191 5670 |Federal OW TA
RWU 70 (23-22A) RW 23-22A INESW 22 | 070S | 220E | 4304715192 | 5670 |Federal OW P
RWU 71 (21-18C) RW 21-18C NENW | 18 | 070S | 240E | 4304715193 | 5670 |Federal OW p
RWU 72 (23-27B) RW 23-27B NESW 27 | 070S | 230E | 4304715194 | 5670 |Federal OW TA
RWU 74 (12-13B) RW 12-13B ISWNW | 13 | 070S | 230E | 4304715196 = 5670 |Federal |GW S
RWU 75 (21-26B) 'RW 21-26B NENW | 26 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715197 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 76 (32-18C) 'RW 32-18C SWNE 18 | 0708 | 240E | 4304715198 | 5670 |Federal |GW E___ "l
RWU 77 (21-13B) 'RWU 77 (21-13B) NENW | 13 | 070S  230E | 4304715199 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 78 (32-28B) 'RW 32-28B SWNE 28 | 070S | 230E | 4304715200 | 5670 |Federal |[OW P
RWU 79 (12-27B) [RW 12-27B SWNW | 27 | 070S | 230E | 4304715201 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 80 (14-27B) [RW 14-27B SWSW | 27 | 070S  230E | 4304715202 | 5670 |Federal |OW S
RWU 81 (41-31B) RW 41-31B NENE 31 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715203 | 5670 |Federal |OW P

RWU 83 (41-27A) [RW 41-27A NENE 27 | 070S | 220E | 4304715205 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 84 (44-14B) B RW 44-14B SESE 14 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715206 | 5670 |Federal |GW F
RWU 88 (23-18B) RW 23-18B INESW | 18 : 070S | 230E | 4304715210 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 90 (43-21B) RW 43-21B NESE 21 | 070S | 230E | 4304715211 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 92 (11-23B) [RW 11-23B NWNW | 23 | 070S | 230E | 4304715212 | 5670 Federal |OW TA.
RWU 94 (12-22A) RW 12-22A SWNW | 22 | 070S | 220E | 4304715213 | 5670 Federal |[OW P
RWU 23-18C (97) RW 23-18C NESW 18 | 070S | 240E | 4304715216 | 99996 Federal |WI e ]
RWU 99 (12-22B) RW 12-22B SWNW | 22 | 070S | 230E | 4304715218 | 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 100-A (43-21A) RW 43-21A NESE 21 | 0708 | 220E | 4304715219 | 5670 Federal 'WI A
RWU 101 (34-21B) RW 34-21B SWSE | 2i | 070S | 230E | 4304715220 | 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 102 (41-24A) RW 41-24A SENE 24 | 070S | 220E = 4304715221 | 5670 |Federal 'WI A
RWU 103 (34-15B) RW 34-15B SWSE 15 | 070S | 230E | 4304715222 | 5670 |Federal OW P
RWU 108 (32-21B) RW 32-21B |SWNE | 21 | 070S | 230E | 4304715226 @ 5670 Federal [OW [P
RWU 109 (21-28B) RW 21-28B NENW | 28 | 070S | 230E | 4304715227 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 110 (23-23A) RW 23-23A NESW | 23 | 070S | 220E | 4304715228 | 5670 |Federal |OW P 1
RWU 111 (32-24A) RW 32-24A SWNE | 24 | 070S | 220E | 4304715229 | 5670 |Federal |OW S
RWU 112 (32-28A) RW 32-28A SWNE | 28 | 070S | 220E | 4304715230 | 5670 |Federal |OW S
RWU 115 (21-19B) RW 21-19B NENW | 19 | 070S | 230E | 4304715233 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 119 (43-29A) RW 43-29A NESE 29 | 070S | 220E | 4304715236 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 120 (23-28B) RW 23-28B NESW | 28 | 070S | 230E | 4304715237 | 5670 |Federal |OW 'TA
RW 13-13B RW 13-13B NWSW | 13 | 070S | 230E | 4304715238 | 5670 |Federal |GW P
RWU 122 (24-14B) RW 24-14B SESW 14 | 070S = 230E | 4304715239 | 5670 Federal |OW P
RWU 125 (34-19B) RW 34-19B SWSE 19 | 070S | 230E | 4304715242 | 5670 Federal |OW TA
RWU 126 (41-29A) RW 41-29A NENE 29 : 070S | 220E | 4304715243 | 5670 Federal [OW P




3of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4130/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name = SEC | TWP | RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status
RWU 127 (12-19B) 5 19 | 070S | 230E | 4304715244 | 5670 ] Federal |[OW S
RWU 129 (14-15B) 'RW 14-15B SWSW 15 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715246 | 5670 Federal |OW P
RWU 133 (41-34B) RW 41-34B NENE 34 | 070S | 230E | 4304715250 | 5670 !Federa]_ oW P i
RWU 136 (43-19B) RW 43-19B NESE 19 | 0708 | 230F | 4304715252 | 5670 Federal |[OW TA
RWU 137 (34-28B) ~ |RW 34-28B |SWSE 28 | 070S | 230E | 4304715253 | 5670 Federal |GW TA
RWU 138 (41-30B) [RW 41-30B 'NENE 30 | 0705 | 230E | 4304715254 | 5670 |Federal OW P
RWU 140 (24-22B) [RW 24-22B [SESW 22 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715255 | 5670 Federal |OW P
RWU 141 (11-27B) RW 11-27B NWNW | 27 | 070S | 230E | 4304715256 | 5670 |Federal OW TA
RWU 143 (33-14B) RW 33-14B NWSE 14 | 0708 | 230E = 4304715257 | 5670 Federal |OW I
RWU 144 (21-18B) RW 21-18B NENW 18 | 070S | 230E | 4304715258 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RW 24-13B RW 24-13B SESW 13 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715259 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 147 (22-22B) RW 22-22B SENW 22 | 070S | 230E 4304715260 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 148 (13-22B) RW 13-22B NWSW | 22 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715261 | 99996 |Federal |WI (A |
RWU 150 (31-22B) RW 31-22B NWNE 22 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715263 | 99996 |Federal |WI |
RWU 151 (42-14B) RW 42-14B SENE | 14 | 070S | 230E | 4304715264 | 5670 |Federal |OW |P
RWU 153 (14-29B) RW 14-29B SWSW 29 | 070S | 230E | 4304715265 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 156 (23-15B) RW 23-15B NESW 15 | 070S | 230E | 4304715267 | 99990 [Federal |WI A
RWU 158 (32-30B) RW 32-30B SWNE 36 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715268 | 5670 Federal OW B B
RWU 160 (32-15B) RW 32-15B SWNE 15 | 070S | 230E | 4304715270 | 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 161 (14-20B) RW 14-20B SWSW 20 | 070S | 230E | 4304715271 | 99996 Federal |WI I
RWU 162 (12-20B) RW 12-20B SWNW | 20 | 070S | 230E | 4304715272 | 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 164 (12-28B) RW 12-28B SWNW | 28 | 070S | 230E | 4304715274 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 165 (32-26B) RW 32-26B SWNE 26 | 070S | 230E | 4304715275 | 5670 |Federal |GW TA
RWU 167 (23-21B) RW 23-21B NESW 21 | 0705 | 230E | 4304715277 @ 5670 |Federal |OW S _
RWU 168 (23-24B) RW 23-24B NESW 24 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715278 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 172 (21-30B) RW 21-30B NENW 30 | 070S | 230E | 4304715280 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 174 (21-20B) RW 21-20B NENW 20 | 070S | 230E | 4304715281 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 176 (31-28B) RW 31-28B 'NWNE 28 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715283 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 177 (42-28B) RW 42-28B [SENE 28 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715284 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RW 22-13B RW 22-13B SENW 13 | 070S | 230E | 4304715285 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 180 (31-23B) RW 31-23B NWNE 23 | 070S | 230E | 4304715287 | 5670 |Federal \OW TA
RWU 181 (34-30B) |IRW 34-30B SWSE 30 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715288 | 5670 Federal OW P
RW 33-13B |[RW 33-13B INWSE 13 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715289 | 5670 |Federal |WI Av"0
RWU 184 (23-26B) [RW 23-26B NESW 26 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715290 | 5670 §_Eederal_ GwW S
RWU 188 (23-20B) RW 23-20B NESW 20 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715291 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 192 (41-33A) RW 41-33A NENE 33 | 070S | 220E | 4304715294 | 5670 |Federal |OW R o
RWU 193 (43-24B) RW 43-24B NESE | 24 | 0705 | 230E | 4304715295 | 5670 |Federal |GW TA
RWU 194 (12-14B) RW 12-14B SWNW 14 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715296 | 5670 |Federal |OW [S
RWU 196 (23-17C) RW 23-17C NESW 17 | 0708 | 240E | 4304715298 | 5670 |Federal |GW TA
RWU 199 (43-22A) RW 43-22A _INESE 22 | 070S | 220E | 4304715301 | 99996 |Federal |WI A ]
RWU 201 (32-28C) RW 32-28C ISWNE 28 | 070S | 240F | 4304715302 | 5670 |Federal |GW P




40f7 QEP Uinta Basin {N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT
Original Well Name - [Q/Q | SEC | TWP | RNG API Entity [Lease  |Well Type |Status
¥ =
RWU 202 (21-34A) RW 21-34A NENW | 34 | 070S | 220E | 4304715303 | 99996 |Federal |WI I
RWU 204 (23-25A) RW 23-25A NESW 25 | 070S | 220E | 4304715305 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 205 (23-21C) RW 23-21C INESW | 21 | 070S | 240E | 4304715306 | 5670 |Federal |GW TA
RWU 2 (14-24B) RW 14-24B SWSW | 24 | 070S | 230E | 4304716472 | 99996 |Federal |WI A
RWU 7 (41-27B) RW 41-27B NENE 27 | 070S | 230E | 4304716473 | 99996 |Federal |WI I
RWU 16 (43-28B) RW 43-28B NESE 28 | 070S | 230E | 4304716475 | 99996 |Federal |WI I
RWU 25 (23-23B) RW 23-23B ~ |NESW 23 | 070S | 230F | 4304716476 | 99996 Federal |WI A
RWU 59 (12-24B) RW 12-24B SWNW | 24 | 070S | 230E | 4304716477 | 99996 |Federal |WI A
RWU 61 (12-27A) RW 12-27A SWNW | 27 | 070S | 220E | 4304716478 | 99996 |Federal |\WI I
RWU 91 (33-22B) RW 33-22B NWSE 22 | 070S | 230E | 4304716479 | 99996 Federal |WI A ]
RWU 93 (43-27B) - RW 43-27B NESE 27 | 0708 | 230E | 4304716480 | 99996 [Federal |WI I
RWU 6 (41-21B) RW 41-21B 'NENE 21 | 070S | 230E | 4304716482 | 99996 Federal |WI A
RWU 68 (41-13B) RW 41-13B |NENE 13 | 0708 | 230E | 4304716485 | 99996 [Federal |WI T 3
RWU 170 (41-15B) RW 41-15B NENE 15 | 0708 | 230E | 4304716495 | 99996 Federal |WI I
RWU 173 (21-21B) RW 21-21B NENW | 21 | 070S  230E | 4304716496 | 99996 Federal |WI _|A
RWU 182 (14-21B) RW 14-21B SWSW | 21 | 070S | 230E | 4304716497 | 99996 |Federal |WI A
RWU 185 (41-1B) RW 41-14B NENE | 14 | 070S  230E | 4304716498 | 99996 Federal |WI A
RWU 212 (41-8F) RW 41-8F NENE 08 | 080S | 240F | 4304720014 | 5670 |Federal |GW P
RWU 213 (41-33B) RW 41-33B NENE 33 | 070S | 230E | 4304720060 | 99996 |Federal |WD A
RWU 215 (43-28A) RW 43-28A NESE | 28 | 070S | 220E | 4304730058 | 99996 |Federal |WD A
RWU 216 (21-274) RW 21-27A NENW | 27 | 070S | 220E | 4304730103 | 99996 |Federal |WI A
RWU 219 (44-21C) RW 44-21C SESE 21 | 070S | 240F | 4304730149 | 5670 |Federal |[GW S
RWU 220 (22-23B) RW 22-23B SENW | 23 | 070S | 230E | 4304730192 | 5670 |Federal |[OW TA
RWU 221 (13-27B) RW 13-27B NWSW | 27 | 070S | 230E | 4304730199 | 5670 |Federal OW TA
RWU 222 (31-27B) RW 31-27B INWNE | 27 | 070S | 230E | 4304730200 | 5670 |Federal GW TA
RWU 224 (44-22B) RW 44-22B SESE 22 | 070S | 230E | 4304730202 | 5670 |Federal |GW ITa |
RWU 225 (13-23B) RW 13-23B INWSW | 23 | 070S | 230E | 4304730212 | 5670 |Federal .GW TA
RWU 226 (24-23B) RW 24-23B SESW 23 | 070S | 230E | 4304730249 | 5670 |Federal |GW S
RWU 227 (14-26B) RW 14-26B SWSW | 26 | 070S | 230E | 4304730257 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 228 (21-34B) RW 21-34B NENW | 34 | 070S | 230E | 4304730258 | 5670 Federal |OW P
RWU 229 (43-26B) RW 43-26B NESE | 26 | 070S | 230E | 4304730259 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 230 (14-18C) RW 14-18C SWSW | 18 | 070S | 240E | 4304730309 | 5670 |Federal |[OW P
RWU 231 (21-35B) |RW 21-35B NENW | 35 | 070S | 230E ' 4304730310 | 5670 Federal |OW TA
RWU 232 (12-26B) RW 12-26B SWNW | 26 | 0708 | 230E 4304730311 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 233 (12-25B) RW 12-25B SWNW | 25 | 070S | 230E | 4304730312 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 234 (32-24B) RW 32-24B |SWNE 24 | 0708 | 230E | 4304730313 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 235 (34-18C) RW 34-18C |SWSE 18 | 070S | 240FE | 4304730314 | 5670 |Federal |OW S
RWU 236 (21-19C) RW 21-19C NENW | 19 | 070S | 240E | 4304730340 | 5670 |Federal GW P
RWU 237 (14-25B) RW 14-25B SWSW | 25 | 070S | 230E | 4304730341 | 5670 |Federal OW P
RWU 238 (32-35B) RW 32-35B SWNE | 35 | 070S | 230E | 4304730342 | 5670 |Federal |OW ITA
RWU 239 (41-35B) RW 41-35B NENE 35 | 070S | 230E | 4304730343 | 5670 |Federal |OW ITA




50f 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460} to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4{30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT
Original Well Name - |QQ SEC | TWP | RNG API Entity |[Lease  |Well Type |Status
<) iy
RWU 240 (12-36B) RW 12-36B SWNW 36 | 0708 | 230E | 4304730344 | 5670 |Federal |OW S
RWU 241 {22-14B) RW 22-14B SENW 14 | 0708 | 230E | 4304730345 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RW 42-13B RW 42-13B SENE 13 | 0708 | 230E | 4304730346 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 243 {(42-18C) RW 42-18C SENE 18 | 0708 | 240E | 4304730347 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 244 (23-19C) RW 23-19C NESW 19 | 0708 | 240E | 4304730348 | 5670 |Federal |GW p
RWU 246 (22-18C) RW 22-18C SENW 18 | 0708 | 240E | 4304730387 | 5670 |Federal |OW p
RWU 247 (22-17C) RW 22-17C SENW 17 | 0705 | 240E | 4304730388 | 5670 Federal |GW P
RWU 258 (34-22A) RW 34-22A SWSE 22 | 070S | 220E | 4304730458 | 5670 Federal WI A
RWU 262 (22-26B) RW 22-26B SENW 26 | 0708 | 230E | 4304730517 | 5670 |Federal |GW TA
RWU 263 (24-26B) RW 24-26B SESW = 26 | 0708 | 230E | 4304730518 | 99996 Federal |WI I
RWU 264 (31-35B) RW 31-35B NWNE 35 | 0708 | 230E . 4304730519 | 99996 Federal |WI A
RWU 265 (44-26B) RW 44-26B SESE 26 | 0708 | 230E @ 4304730520 | 5670 |Federal GW P
RWU 266 (33-26B) RW 33-26B INWSE | 26 | 070S | 230E 4304730521 | 99996 |Federal WI I
RWU 269 (13-26B) |[RW 13-26B NWSW 26 | 0708 | 230E | 4304730522 | 99996 |Federal (WI A
RWU 273 (42-27B) RW 42-27B - SENE 27 | 0708 | 230E | 4304731051 | 5670 |Federal |OW |TA
RWU 279 (11-36B) RW 11-36B NWNW | 36 | 070S | 230E | 4304731052 | 99996 |Federal |WI A
RWU 276 (44-27B) RW 44-27B ) SESE 27 | 070S | 230E | 4304731053 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 272 (44-23B) RW 44-23B SESE | 23 ' 070S ' 230E | 4304731054 | 5670 |Federal |GW P
RWU 278 (11-26) |RW 11-26 NWNW | 26 | 470S | 230E | 4304731076 | 5670 |Federal |GW TA
RWU 275 (31-26B) RW 31-26B NWNE 26 | 0708 | 230E | 4304731677 | 99996 |Federal |WI A
RWU 280 (11-35B) 'RW 11-35B NWNW | 35 | 0708 | 230E | 4304731079 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 282 (42-26B) ‘RW 42-26B SENE 26 | 0708 | 230E | 4304731080 | 5670 Federal |GW TA
RWU 271 (42-35B) RW 42-35B SENE 35 | 070S | 230E | 4304731081 | 5670 Federal |WI |
RWU 270 (22-35B) RW 22-35B SENW 35 | 070S | 230E | 4304731082 | 5670 Federal |[OW P
RWU 284 (33-23B) RW 33-23B NWSE 23 | 0708 | 230E | 4304731476 | 5670 '_Fedcral GW TA
RWU 285 (11-24B) RW 11-24B NWNW | 24 | 0708 | 230E | 4304731477 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 286 (42-21B) RW 42-21B SENE 21 | 070S | 230E | 4304731478 | 5670 |Federal OW P
RW 44-13B RW 44-13B SESE 13 | 070S | 230E | 4304731512 | 5670 |Federal OW TA
RWU 288 (24-27) RW 24-27 SESW 27 | 070S | 230E | 4304731513 | 567G |Federal OW TA
RWU 289 (13-24B) RW 13-24B ~ NWSW | 24 | 070S | 230E | 4304731517 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 292 {42-23B) RW 42-23B :SENE 23 | 0708 | 230E | 4304731576 | 5670 |Federal |GW TA
RWU 295 {11-22B) RW 11-22B NWNW | 22 | 070S | 230E | 4304731577 | 5670 |Federal |GW TA
RWU 296 {(12-35B) RW 12-35B SWNW 35 | 070S | 230E | 4304731578 | 5670 |Federal |OW S
RWU 297 {(24-15B) RW 24-15B SESW 15 | 070S | 230E | 4304731579 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 293 (22-22A) RW 22-22A SENW | 22 | 070S | 220 | 4304731581 | 5670 |Federal |OW TA
RWU 294 (24-18C) RW 24-18C B SESW 18 | 0708 | 240E | 4304731582 | 5670 Federal |GW P
RWU 298 (22-27B) RW 22-27B SENW 27 | 0708 | 230E | 4304731679 | 5670 Federal |OW TA
RWU 301 (43-15B) RW 43-15B NESE 15 | 0705 | 230E | 4304731682 | 5670 |Federal |GW TA
RWU 302 (22-24B) RW 22-24B SENW 24 | 0708 | 230E | 4304731683 @ 5670 |Federal |GW TA
RWU 303 (34-17B) RW 34-17B L —n SWSE 17 | 070S | 230E | 4304731819 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RED WASH 305 {(41-4F) RW 41-4F C-NE 04 | 080S | 240E = 4304732538 | 5670 |Federal |GW TA




6of7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT
Original Well Name - QQ SEC | TWP | RNG API Entity |Lease Well Type | Status
i |
RED WASH 306 RW 23-23C NESW 23 | 070S | 240E | 4304732629 | 5670 |Federal |GW P _
RWU 207 RW 14-17B |SWSW 17 | 0708 | 230E | 4304732738 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RED WASH UNIT 261 RW 23-17B NESW 17 | 0708 | 230E | 4304732739 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 268 (43-17B) RW 43-17B - NESE 17 | 0705 | 230E | 4304732980 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 267 (32-17B) RW 32-17B SWNE 17 | 0708 | 230E | 4304732981 | 5670 |Federal |[OW P
RWU 283 (43-18B) RW 43-18B NESE 18 | 0708 | 230E | 4304732982 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 299 (32-18B) RW 32-18B SWNE 18 | 070S | 230E | 4304733018 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 42-20B RW 42-20B SENE 20 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733490 | 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 22-20B RW 22-20B SENW 20 | 070S | 230E | 4304733491 | 5670 Federal OW S
RWU 24-19B RW 24-19B SESW 19 | 070S | 230E @ 4304733492 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 13-19B RW 13-19B NWSW | 19 | 070S | 230E = 4304733497 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 13-20B RW 13-20B NWSW = 20 | 070S | 230E | 4304733498 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 33-19B RW 33-19B NWSE 19 : 0708 | 230E | 4304733499 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 33-20B RW 33-20B - NWSE 20 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733500 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RED WASH 22-21B RW 22-21B SENW | 21 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733522 | 5670 |Federal |OW S
RED WASH 24-20B [RW 24-20B B |SESW 20 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733523 | 5670 |Federal |OW [P
RED WASH 44-19B RW 44-19B SESE | 19 | 070S | 230E | 4304733524 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RED WASH 44-20B RW 44-20B \SESE 20 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733525 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
[RWU 11-19B RW 11-19B NWNW | 19 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733552 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 11-20B RW 11-20B NWNW | 20 | 070S | 230E | 4304733553 | 5670 |Federal WI A
RWU 24-18B RW 24-18B SESW 18 | 070S | 230E | 4304733554 | 5670 Federal OW P l
RWU 31-19B RW 31-19B NWNE 16 | 070S | 230E | 4304733555 | 5670 |Federal |(WI A
RWU 42-19B RW 42-19B SENE 18 | 070S | 236E | 4304733556 . 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 22-19B RW 22-19B SENW 19 | 070S | 230E | 4304733559 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 23-24A RW 23-24A |NESW 24 | 070S | 220E = 4304733567 | 367C |Federal |OW P
RWU 34-24A RW 34-24A SWSE 24 | 070S | 220E | 4304733568 | 5670 |Federal |WI |A
RWU 42-24A RW 42-24A B SENE 24 | 070S | 220E | 4304733569 | 5670 |Federal |OW S
RWU 11-25A RW 11-25A NWNW | 25 ' 070S | 220F | 4304733574 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 13-25A RW 13-25A NWSW | 25 . 0708 | 220E | 4304733575 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 21-25A - RW 21-25A NENW | 25 | 070S ' 220E | 4304733576 5670 |Federal |OW P —]
RWU 31-25A RW 31-25A NWNE 25 | 070S | 220E | 4304733577 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 33-25A |RW 33-25A NWSE 25 | 070S | 220E | 4304733578 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RW 41-25AX RW 41-25A NENE 25 | 0708 | 220E | 4304733579 | 5670 |Federal OW P
RWU 42-25A RWU 42-25A 'SENE 25 | 0708 | 220E | 4304733580 | 5670 Federal |OW TA
RWU 11-29B RW 11-29B - NWNW | 29 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733590 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 12-24A RW 12-24A SWNW | 24 | 070S | 220E | 4304733591 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 21-24A RW 21-24A NENW | 24 | 0708 | 220E = 4304733592 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 34-13A RW 34-13A SWSE | 13 | 070S | 220E | 4304733593 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 44-18B RW 44-18B SESE 18 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733594 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RW 22-13A RW 22-13A SENW 13 | 070S | 220E | 4304733765 | 13296 |Federal [OW S
RWU 22-29B RW 22-29B SENW | 29 | 070S | 230E | 4304733766 | 5670 [Federal OW S




7Tof7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name - |QQ SEC | TWP | RNG API Entity |Lease Well Type |Status
RWU 41-24A RW 41-24A NENE 24 | 070S | 220E | 4304733769 | 5670 |Federal |OW |
RWU 42-30B RW 42-30B SENE | 30 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733771 | 5670 |Federal OwW P
RWU 44-30B RWU 44-30B SESE 30 | 070S | 230E | 4304733772 | 5670 |Federal |[OW P il
RWU 11-30B RW 11-30B NWNW = 30 | 070S | 230E | 4304733785 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 22-25A RW 22-25A SENW | 25 | 070S | 220E | 4304733786 | 5670 |Federal |OW P
RWU 31-30B RW 31-30B NWNE l 30 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733788 | 5670 |Federal |WI A
RWU 33-30B RW 33-30B NWSE | 30 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733790 | 5670 |Federal WL A
RED WASH U 34-27C RW 34-27C SWSE 27 | 070S | 240E | 4304735045 | 5670 |Federal GW |P
[RWU 34-22C RW 34-22C SWSE | 22 070S | 240E | 4304735098 | 5670 |Federal GW P
RW 12G-20C RW 12G-20C _ |SWNW 20 | 070S | 240E | 4304735239 | 14011 |Federal |GW S
RW 43G-08F RW 43G-08F NESE 08 | 080S | 240E | 4304735655 Federal |GW |APD
RW 22G-09F RW 22G-09F SENW 09 | 080S | 240E | 4304735656 | 15636 |Federal |GW 1OPS
RWU 34-23AG RW 34-23AG SWSE 23 | 0708 | 220E | 4304735668 @ 5670 Federal |OW P
RWU 34-27AG RWU 34-27AD SWSE 27 | 0708 | 220E | 4304735669 | 5670 |Federal |OW DRL
RWU 32-27AG RWU 32-27AG 'SWNE 27 | 0708 | 220F | 4304735670 5670 Federal |OW S
RW 14-34AMU RW 14-34 AMU SWSW 34 | 070S | 220FE | 4304735671 | 14277 |Federal |GW P
RW 12-08FG RW 12-08FG -TSWNW___US 080S | 240F | 4304736348 Federal |GW APD
RW 44-08FG RW 44-08FG SESE 08 | 080S | 240E | 4304736349 | 15261 |Federal |GW P
RW 12-17FG RW 12-17FG SWNW 17 | OBOS | 240E | 4304736350 Federal |GW APD
RW 34-34 AMU RW 34-34 AD SWSE | 34 | 070S | 220E | 4304736351 Federal |GW APD
RW 44-35 AMU RW 44-35 AMU SESE 35 | 0708 | 220E | 4304736352 | Federal |GW APD
RW 14-35 AMU RW 14-35 AMU SWSW 35 | 0708 | 220E | 4304736354 Federal |GW APD
RW 33-31 BMU RW 33-31 BD NWSE 31 | 070S | 230E | 4304736357 Federal |GW APD
RW 13-31 BMU RW 13-31 BD NWSW | 31 | 070S | 230E | 4304736358 Federal |GW APD
RW 32-15FG RW 32-15FG SWNE | 15 @ 080S | 240E | 4304736443 Federal |GW APD
RW 21-26AG RW 21-26AD NENW | 26 | 070S | 220E | 4304736768 Federal |OW APD
RW 43-26 AG RW 43-26AG NESE 26 | 070S 220E | 4304736769 Federal |OW APD
RW 43-23AG RW 43-23AG NESE 23 | 0708 | 220E | 4304736770 Federal |OW APD
RW 41-26AG [RW 41-26AG NENE 26 | 070S | 220E | 4304736318 [ Federal |[OW |APD
RW 04-25BG RW 04-25B NWSW 25 | 0708 | 230E | 4304736982 | Federal |OW APD
RW 01-25BG RW 01-25BG NWNW | 25 | 070S | 230E | 4304736983 Federal |[OW APD
RW 04-26BG RW 04-26BG SESW 26 | 0708 | 230E | 4304736984 Federal |OW APD
RW 01-26BG RW 01-26BG SWNW 26 | 070S @ 230E | 4304736985 Federal OW APD
RW 01-35BG RW 01-35BG SWNW 35 | 070S | 230E | 4304736986 Federal OW APD




1 0f 1 QEP Uinta Basin {N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT
Original Well Name o [oYe) SEC | TWP | RNG API Entity Lease  Well Type Status
i el - | |
RWU 51 {12-16B) RW 12-16B SWNW i6 | 0708 | 230E | 43064715177 | 5670 %State oW P
RWU ST 189 (41-16B) RW 41-16B NENE i6 | 0708 | 230E | 4304715292 | 5670 State OW S
RED WASH UNIT 259 RW 14-16B SWSW 16 | 070S | 230E | 4304732785 | 5670 State ow P
RED WASH UNIT 260 RW 34-16B SWSE 16 | 070S | 230E | 4304732786 | 5670 State oW P
RWU 324 (23-16B) RW 23-16B SESW 16 | 070S | 230E | 4304733084 | 5670 |State WI OPS
RWU 21W-36A RWU 21W-36A NENW 36 | 0705 | 220E = 4304733730 State GW [LA
RWU 21G-36A RWU 21G-36A NENW 36 | 0708 | 220E = 4304733731 |State oW LA
RWU 41-36A RWU 41-36A NENE 36 | 0708 | 220E | 4304733732 |State ow LA
RWU 43-16B RWU 43-16B NESE 16 | 0708 | 230E | 4304733733 State ow LA
RWU 21-16B RWU 21-16B NENW 16 | 070S  230E | 4304733734 State oW LA
RWU 11-36A RWU 11-36A NWNW | 36 | 0708  220E | 4304733736 State ow LA
RWU 13-36A RWU 13-36A NWSW = 36 | 070S  220E | 4304733737 State oW LA
RW 32G-16C RW 32G-16C SWNE 16 | 070S | 240E | 4304735238 | 5670 |State GW P
RW 14-36 AMU RW 14-36 AMU SWSW 36 | 0708 | 220E | 4304736721 State GW APD
RW 01-36BG RW 01-36BG NWNW | 36 | 070S | 230E | 4304736887 | 5670 |State  |OW S
RW 24-16BG RW 24-16BG SESW 16 | 0708 | 230E | 4304737746 | 5670 |State oW DRL
RW 12-32BG RW 12-32BG SWNW | 32 | 0708 | 230E | 4304737946 | 15841 |State IGW DRL




STATE OF UTAH
DEFPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

FORM 9

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
see attached

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRI-BE NAME:
see attached

Do not use this form for propasals to drifl new wells, significantly despen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TQ DRILL form for such proposals.

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
see attached

1. TYPE OF WELL
oL wer ] GASWELL [] OTHER

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

see attached

2. NAME OF OPERATOR-

QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY

8. API NUMBER.
attached

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR. PHONE NUMBER:
1050 17th Street Sulte 500 . . Denver srare €O ,,-80265 (303) 308-3068

10, FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDGAT:

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: attached

county: Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT O O O
(Submit in Duplicate) ] ALTeR cAsiNG [] rracture Rear [ siberrack To REPAR WELL
Approximate date work will start. ][] CASING REPAIR [T] NewconsTRuGTION [[] vemporARILY ABANDON
1/1/2007 [] cHange To PREVIOUS PLANS [] operaTOR cHANGE [[J TuemngrePaR
[T] cHance TuBING [[] PLuG AND ABANDON [] ventorFLaRe
[0 susseQUENT REFORT [] cHANGE WELL NAME [ Puesack [T] wartER DISPOSAL
(Submit Originat Form Only)
[] cHance wew sTaTus [[] erooucTioN (START/RESUME) [} water sHuT-oFF
Date of work completion:
[J commINGLE PRODUGING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE /] omer: Operator Name
] cowvert weLL Tvre [(] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Change

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED QR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective January 1, 2007 operator of record, QEP Uinta Basin, Inc., will hereafter be known as QUESTAR EXPLORATION
AND PRODUCTION COMPANY. This name change involves only an internal corporate name change and no third party
change of operator is involved. The same employees will continue to be responsible for operations of the properties described

on the attached list. All operations will continue to be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLM Reference No. ESB000024)

" Utah State Bond Number: 965003033 W
Fee Land Bond Number: 965003033
Current operator of record, QEP UINTA BASIN, INC
attached list.

hereby r

"signs as operator of the properties as described on the

—e—

Ja /‘3 Nagsd, Executive Vice Presid
Successor operator of record, QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND P

and obligations as operator of the properties as descrj

ent, QEP Uinta Basin, Inc,
RODUCTION COMPANY, hereby assumes all rights, duties

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) _Dfﬁ'% K. Stanberry 5 ) me oSupervisor, Regulatory Affairs

. o -
SIGNATURE //,éi_,f L )4-‘4-“—'%‘_‘“‘\ DATE 3/16/2007
7 — L?

{This space for Stato use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

RECFVED
APR 13 2007
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MiNityi-




STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
see attached

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new weils, significantly despen axisting wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged walls, or to
drill horizontal laterals Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
see attached

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
see attached

1 TYPE OF WELL

oL werr [ GASWELL ] OTHER

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
see attached

2. NAME OF OPERATOR.

QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY

. APINUMBER:
attached

PHONE NUMBER:

(303) 308-3068

Denver

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
1050 17th Street Sulte 500 crnre @O -, 80265

10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: attached

county: Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH
Ih CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[Z] NOTICE OF INTENT [[] acioize [] oeeen [} REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submitin Duplicate) [ atercasing [7] FracTuRE TREAT [[] sioetrack To REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start; [7] casing repair [C] newconstrucTiON [C] TeEmMPORARILY ABANDON
1/1/2007 [ cHance TO PREVIOUS PLANS [] operator cHanGE [ rtueine Repar
] cHance TUBING [] rLuc aND ABANDON [ ventorFiare
(] suBSEQUENT REPORT [] cHaneE weLL name [[] rweeack [[] waTer pisposaL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[C] cHaNGE wELL STATUS [] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [] water shuT-0F¢
Date of work compiation:
[[] coMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ RecLamaTION OF WELL SITE & orHer: Well Name Changes
[7 convert wew Tvee [] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

2. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent detalls including dates, depths, volumes, etc,
PER THE ATTACHED LIST OF WELLS, QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY REQUESTS THAT THE

INDIVIDUAL WELL NAMES BE UPDATED IN YOUR RECORDS.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Dé(K Staptierry

e Supervisor, Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATURE /////...../ ‘/_%

ﬁq,;,%_mmg 4/17/2007

< 2

I’...._o-"’
{This space for State use only)

(5/2000} (Sea Instructions on Reverse Side)

RECEIVED
APR 19 2007

UIV.OF OIL, GAS & MINING




United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.0. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
uT-922

April 23, 2007

Questar Exploration and Production Company
1050 17th Street, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265

Re: Red Wash Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

On April 12, 2007, we received an indenture dated April 6, 2007, whereby QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
resigned as Unit Operator and Questar Exploration and Production Company was designated as
Successor Unit Operator for the Red Wash Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effective April 23, 2007.
In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the
designated party has obtained all required approval that would entitle it to conduct operations under
the Red Wash Unit Agreement.

Your nationwide oil and gas bond No. ESB000024 will be used to cover all federal operations within
the Red Wash Unit.

It is requested that you notify all interested parties of the change in unit operator. Copies of the
approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriate federal offices, with one copy returned
herewith.

Sincerely,

/s/ Greg J. Noble

Greg J. Noble
Acting Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals
Enclosure
bce:  Field Manager - Vernal (w/enclosure)
SITLA

Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
File - Red Wash Unit (w/enclosure)

Agr. Sec. Chron e EIVED
Reading File ik
Central Files APR 3 0 2007

UT922: TAThompson:tt:4/23/07

DIV, GF O, CAS & MINING



Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April 2004 DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expres March 3 2007
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT RPN
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU 081
6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side. 7. I Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well Redwash
OlWel  [JGesWell [ JOter v
RW 23-13B
2. Name of Operator Questar Exploration and Production Company 5 APl Well No.
3a Address 3b. Phone No. finclude area code} 43-047-15157
1050 17th Street, Suite 500  Denver CO 80265 303 308-3068 T0. Field and Pook, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R, M, or Survey Description) Redwash
1889’ FSL & 1924' FWL NESW SEC.13-T7S-R23E 11. County or Parish, State
Ulintah
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTKE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
] Acidice L] Deepen L] production (StarvResume)  [_IWater shus-off
[ZINotice of ntent ] Ateer Casing L Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integity
[Isubsequent Report [ Casing Repair New Construction L Recornplete Other
Ol | E]change Plans Plugand Abandon L] Temporarily Abandon
Final A Notice D Convert to Injection Plug Back D Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Questar Exploration and Production Company (QEP) requests appraval to place this well in TA status. This well was originally drilled in
October 1953 and completed in January 1954 as an ofi well producing from the Green River formation. The well was shut in September 1991,
In September 1994 Chevron, then aperator, tested this well as 2 gas well and it produced until September 1999. QEP is in the process of
reviewing this well and other long term shut-in wells in the Redwash field and would like additional time to determine the future viability of this
wellbore.

re

e s v S AREAR

RECEIVED
SEP 1 % 2007

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

14. 1 hereby ECMM the fo

Name (Printed/Type
Debra ta/yb/erry pa / p

Title Supervisor, Regulatory Affairs

Signature / / 4 09/11/2007
7 -
THIS SPACE FOR FEDE OR STATE OFFICE USE
Approvedby e Title p .—ppmcd BY 1€ pue _A%‘_Qﬂh\s
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or 1ah DN\‘%\Q“ i ederal ry
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease | ogfice U - M\n\ng Ac“on \S NeceSSa
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Ga B In

Title 18 US.C. Section 1001 and Tite43 US.C. Section 1212, make ita crime for any person knowmgl ;
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations a fo any matter mqnq ity ;qn)g:\ :

or agency of the United

(Instructions on page 2)

iy




Questar Exploration and Production Company

QUESTAR
1350 17th Street, Surte 560

Denver, CO 80265
Tel 303 672 6300 » Fax 302 294 9332

Denver Division

September 12, 2007

Bureau of Land Management
Vemal Field Office

170 South 500 East

Vernal, Utah 84078

Red Wash Field
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Enclosed are the original and two copies of four (4) Sundries requesting that the
respective wells be placed in TA status. These Sundries are the result of a Notice of
Incident of Noncompliance issued by your office August 15, 2007, copy attached.
Questar Exploration and Production Company obtained these wells, along with many
others, in 1999 from Shenandoah Energy, Inc. and has not yet evaluated all the existing
wells on a case by case basis to determine their future.

Thank you for your consideration of our request for these wells to be placed into TA
status. Please contact me at (303) 308-3068 if you have questions or need any additional
information at this time.

Sincerely, )

e v
7 o s - ) ’w’l"z’ -

Dé a K Stanberry
Supervisor, Regulatory Affairs

Enclosures

cc: State of Utah
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

P. 0. Box 145801 RECEIVED
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801
SEP 1 4 2007

DIV.OF OIL, GAS & MINING



2007-09-11 13:49 JAN >> 3032952468 P12

Pom 31609 Nunbwer AWQ7027
(l)eu{mber 1989) Page of
UNITED STATES > LT
Cerifid Mail- Retam DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR O 1 E—
N ovoN005876354 BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Tewe  UTUDSSE.
- - CA
[ sy etversaResive NOTICE OF INCIDENTS OF NONCOMPLIANCE [
PA UTUB30100
Burean of | and Management Office Operatos
VERNAL FIELD QOFFICE QUESTAR EXPL & PROD COMPANY
Address 170 SOUTH 500 EAST Adlresy 1571 EAST 1700 SOUTH
VERNAL UT 84078 VERNAL UT 84078
Telephone Auention
435-781-4504
Inspector Altn Addr
ALAN WALKER
Site Nurme: Well or Fiility 174 174 Section | Township Runpe Meridian County Staie
RW 21.24B NENW 24 78 23E SLe UINTAH uTt
Site Nore Well or Facility 174 1/4 Section | Township Ranpe Meridian County State
{SEE ATTACHED)
'K FOLLOWING VIOLATION WAS FOUND RY BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMﬁi INSPECTORS ON THE DATE AND AT THE SITE LISTED ABOVE
Date Time (24 - hour ¢luck) Violation Gravity of Violition
08/15/2007 10:00 43CFR3162.3-4(c) MINOR
C;',"e%ma"'é;" Date Curmected Assessount for Nopcompliance Asgessment Refercice
08/22/2007 43 CFR 3163.1()
Renurks

No well may be temporily abandoned without approval of the Authorized Officer. Correct by:
1. Returning well to production.

2. Submit Sundry Notice requesting approval to prermantely plug and abandon well.

3. Submit Sundry Notice requesting approval 10 temporarily abandon well

‘When violation is comected, sign this notice and return 10 above address.
Compuny Representative Title Signanue Diate
Compuny Comments

WARNING

lncidents of Noncomplianoe vorrection and reporting titmeframes begin upon receipt of this Notice or 7 business days after the date it is mailed, whichever is

carlier. Bach violation must be corrected within the peescribed time from receipt of this Notice and reported to the Bureau of Land Management office at the

address shown ahave. Please noice that you alrcady tmay have been assessed for noncompliance (sec amount under "Assessment for Noncompliance™). If ypu do

not comply as aoted above utider "Carrective Action To Be Completed By™ you may incur an additional assessment under (43 CFR 3163, 1) and may jncur ﬂ
Civil Penaltics (43 CFR 3163.2), Al self-centified carrcetions must be postmarked no later thag the next business day after the preseribed time for corr ,

Tile 43 CFR 3163.2(f)(1), pravides that any person who “kiowingly or willfully” prepares, maintains, or submits, false, inaccurate, or mislcading reports, ==

notices, affidavits, record, data, or ather written information required by thig part shall be liable for a cival penalty of up to $25,000 per violation for each <

day such vinlarion continugs, not 1o exceed a maximum of 20 days. e, - R
REVIEW AND APPEAL RIGHTS s B

A persun contesting a violation shall request a State Dixectgr review of the Incidents of Noncompliance. This request must be filed within 20 working days of -

reecipt of the Incidents of Noncompliance with lhc appropriatc State Director (see 43 CFR 3165.3). The State Director review decision may be appcaled wo the -

Interior Board of Lands Appeals, 801 North Quincy Street, Suitc 300, Arfington VA 22203 (sec 43 CER 3165.4). Contact the above fisted Bureau of Land

Manageinent office for further infurmarion,

=" 2
Section 109(d)(1) of the Federal Oil and Gas Royalty Management Act of 1982, as implemented by the applicable provisions of the operating regulations & “O Q
- 0
s Z

of Land Manapenwent Authorized Officer Dute Time
b £ Jj~/ﬁto7 o
SE ONLY
Number Date Assessment Penalty Tenminstion
83
TyPe ol imjecon

Pl




2007-09-11 13:50 JAN >> 3032952468 P 2/2
Additional information for Incident of Noncompliance Number AW07027 Page 2 of 2
Wells and/or Facilities, continued
Site Name Al Well or Facility 1/4 1/4 Sec Twn Range Mer Lease State  County
RW 3 22 22-218 SENW 21 78 RE 18 ] UTuU0S87 urt UINTAH
RW 5 23138 NESW13 7S  23E SLB UTU081 uT UINTAH
RW 32-28A SWNE28 7§  22E SLB UTU0558 ur UINTAH
AW 41158 NENE1S 78  23E SLB UTUOS ut UINTAH



API Well No: 43047151570000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING U 081 '
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
DRILL form for such proposals. RED WASH
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well RW 23-13B
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO 43047151570000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-4362 Ext RED WASH
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH
1889 FSL 1924 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 13 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [l cHANGE To PREVIOUS PLANS [l cHANGE TuBING [l cHANGE WELL NAME
12/1/2010
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
[] SUBSEQUENT REPORT [ oeepen [1 FRACTURE TREAT [1 NEw consTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
|:| PRODUCTION START OR RESUME |:| RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL / TEMPORARY ABANDON
|:| TUBING REPAIR |:| VENT OR FLARE |:| WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D WATER SHUTOFF D SI TA STATUS EXTENSION D APD EXTENSION
Report Date:
|:| WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION |:| OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Questar Exploration and Production Company (QEP) requests approval for 12
month temporary abandonment status for the above captioned well. Based REQUEST DENIED
upon the results of the RW 34-34ADR, RW 34-27AD and RW 04-25B, QEP is Utah Division of
developing plans to deepen existing Redwash wells with intact 5 1/2" and 7"  Oil, Gas and Mining
production casing to the lower Mesaverde formation. An 8 well pilot program

has been sent to the BLM, based upon the results from this pilot project thBate: { ™ De¢ember 02, 2009 |

well will either be deepened to the lower Mesaverde or plugged and { )5/\ [L Ll,,u,- ;

abandoned. By:
NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jan Nelson 435 781-4331 Permit Agent
SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 12/1/2009




UTAH
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The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

OIL, GAS & MINING

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43047151570000

See requirements of R649-3-22 (showing of integrity).

AgPUESddENLRR
Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

Date: { "\ Detember 02, 2009

i amme:




Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET  (for state use only)
Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/14/2010
FROM: (01d Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N5085-Questar Exploration and Production Company N3700-QEP Energy Company
1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 ' Deaver, CO 80265
Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048 Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048
CA No. Unit: RED WASH
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG|API NO ENTITY |LEASE TYPE|WELL |WELL
NO TYPE STATUS
SEE ATTACHED

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/28/2010

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/28/2010
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/24/2010
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Requested
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5¢c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 8/16/2010 BIA not yet
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 8/16/2010
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 6/29/2010
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Qil and Gas Database on: 6/30/2010
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: __6/30/2010
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965010693

3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965010695

3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:

4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS:

QEP Energy (Red Wash) FORM A xls 06/30/2010



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OiL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER
See attached

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, orto ~

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIiBE NAME:
See attached

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
See attached

1 TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

olL LL GAS LL H
we [ WelL [ orher See attached
2 NAME OF OPERATOR: — 9. API NUMBER;
Questar Exploration and Production Company /V j VA b’ 5 Attached
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR' PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1050 17th Street, Suite 500 ., Denver .2 CO ,,..80265 (303) 672-6900 See attached
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See attached county: Attached
QTR/QTR. SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH
11 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT = O O
(Submit in Duplicate) ] aurercasing [} rracture TrREAT [] SIDETRACK TG REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: | [T]  CASING REPAIR [C] newconsTrucTION (] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
6/14/2010 [} crance 7o PREVIOUS PLANS [} oreraTor cHanee [ Tueine rRerar
[] cHanGE TuBING [] PLUG AND ABANDON [] venTorFLare
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT D CHANGE WELL NAME [:] PLUG BACK D WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[] crance weLL status [[] PRODUCTION (STARTRESUME) [] water sHut-oFF
Date of work compietion:
[] commnGLe PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE ] omer: Operator Name
[1 converTwew Tvpe [ RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Change

2. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Cleary show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective June 14, 2010 Questar Exploration and Production Company changed its name to QEP Energy Company. This name
change involves only an internal corporate name change and no third party change of operator is invoived. The same
employees will continue to be responsible for operations of the properties described on the attached list. All operations will
continue to be covered by bond numbers:

Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLM Reference No. ESB000024) /V 3 70’0
Utah State Bond Number: 965663633 : ' ; -

Fee Land Bond Number: '965603633-> 9@5@/0 673
BIA Bond Number: 789446 G4 50/0(93

The attached document is an all inclusive list of the wells operated by Questar Exploration and Production Company. As of
June 14, 2010 QEP Energy Company assumes all rights, duties and obligations as operator of the properties as described on
the list

NAME (PLEASE PRV MIOrgan Anderson Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE _, OE@L \Aﬂd L )q:ﬂ\/-

_TITLE

6/23/2010

DATE

{This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
JUN 2 8 2010
DIV.OFOIL, GASRMINNG

APPROVED _f /302009
4 A
144 /
Division of Oil, Gas ané%l%{ﬁ
Earlene Russell, Engineering Technician

(5/2000)



Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)

RED WASH

effective June 14, 2010

well_name sec| twp | mg |api entity | mineral |type |stat C
lease
RW 34-23B 23 1 070S | 230E |4304715136 5670 | Federal |IOW |P
RW 41-23B 23 | 070S | 230E 14304715138 5670 | Federal |[OW |P
RW 32-22B 22 | 070S | 230E |4304715139 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 43-23B 23 | 070S | 230E 14304715140 5670 | Federal |JOW |P
RW 32-17C 17 1 0708 | 240E |4304715145 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 34-26B 26 10708 | 230E /4304715148 5670 | Federal | GW |TA
RW 32-14B 14 | 0708 | 230E |4304715150 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 34-14B 14 1 070S | 230E |4304715152 5670 | Federal OW |S
RW 23-22B 22 1070S | 230E 14304715153 5670 | Federal |OW |TA
RW 43-22B 22 1 070S | 230E |4304715155 5670 | Federal (OW |P
RW 32-23B 23 10708 | 230E (4304715156 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 23-13B 13 1 070S | 230E |4304715157 5670 | Federal | GW |TA
RW 34-22B 22 | 0708 | 230E 4304715158 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 32-13B 13 |1 070S | 230E (4304715163 5670 | Federal |\GW |P
RW 14-23B 23 1070S | 230FE /14304715165 5670 | Federal OW |S
RW 14-24A 24 | 070S | 220E |4304715166 17554 | Federal | OW |DRL
RW 21-24B 24 | 070S | 230E |4304715167 5670 | Federal | OW |TA
RW 34-13B 13 10708 | 230E |4304715168 5670 | Federal [OW |P
RW 21-29C 29 | 070S | 240E (4304715169 5670 | Federal |GW |P
RW 12-17B 17 |1 070S | 230E |4304715170 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 32-33C 33 | 070S | 240E |4304715171 5670 | Federal GW |P
RW 14-23A 23 10708 | 220F 14304715176 5670 | Federal OW |P
RW 12-18C 18 | 070S | 240E |4304715183 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 21-22B 22 1 070S | 230E |4304715186 5670 | Federal | GW |TA
RW 34-18B 18 | 0708 | 230E |4304715189 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 21-27B 27 10708 | 230E |4304715191 5670 | Federal | OW |TA
RW 23-22A 22 1 070S | 220FE |4304715192 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 21-18C 18 | 0708 | 240E |4304715193 5670 | Federal |OW [P
RW 12-13B 13 | 070S | 230E 14304715196 5670 | Federal GW |S
RW 32-18C 18 | 070S | 240E (4304715198 5670 | Federal |GW (P
RWU 77 (21-13B) 13 10708 | 230E |4304715199 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 32-28B 28 | 0708 | 230E (4304715200 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 12-27B 27 1070S | 230E 4304715201 5670 | Federal  OW |TA
RW 14-27B 27 | 0708 | 230E 4304715202 5670 | Federal | OW [P
RW 41-31B 31 | 070S | 230E 4304715203 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 41-27A 27 1070S | 220E /4304715205 5670 | Federal |OW |S
RW 44-14B 14 | 0708 | 230E 4304715206 5670 | Federal |GW |P
RW 43-21B 21 10708 | 230E 4304715211 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 12-22A 22 | 070S | 220E |4304715213 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 12-22B 22 | 0708 | 230E [4304715218 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 34-21B 21 | 0708 | 230E 4304715220 5670 | Federal (OW P
RW 34-15B 15 | 0708 | 230E |4304715222 5670 | Federal OW |P
RW 32-21B 2] | 070S| 230E 4304715226 5670 | Federal | OW P
RW 21-28B 28 | 070S | 230E 14304715227 5670 | Federal |IOW |P
Bonds: BLM = ESB000024
BIA = 956010693
State = 965010695 1 of 4




Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
RED WASH
effective June 14, 2010

well_name sec| twp | mg |api entity | mineral |type |[stat |C
lease
RW 23-23A 23 10708 | 220E 14304715228 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 32-24A 24 | 070S | 220E |4304715229 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 32-28A 28 | 0708 | 220E |4304715230 5670 | Federal  OW |S
RW 21-19B 19 10708 | 230E |4304715233 5670 | Federal |(OW |P
RW 43-29A 29 10708 | 220E 14304715236 5670 | Federal |IOW |S C
RW 23-28B 28 | 070S | 230E 14304715237 17525 | Federal |OW |P C
RW 13-13B 13 |070S | 230E |4304715238 5670 | Federal |GW |P
RW 24-14B 14 | 0708 | 230E |4304715239 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 41-29A 29 | 070S | 220FE 14304715243 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 14-15B 15 | 0708 | 230E |4304715246 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 41-34B 34 1 070S | 230E |4304715250 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 41-30B 30 1 070S | 230E 4304715254 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 24-22B 22 10708 | 230E (4304715255 5670 | Federal OW |P
RW 33-14B 14 |1 070S | 230E 4304715257 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 21-18B 18 | 0708 | 230E |4304715258 5670 | Federal |OW |TA
RW 22-22B 22 | 070S | 230E {4304715260 5670 | Federal |OW |TA |C
RW 42-14B 14 1 0708 | 230E {4304715264 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 14-29B 29 | 070S | 230E (4304715265 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 32-30B 30 | 070S | 230F |4304715268 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 32-15B 15 10708 | 230E 14304715270 5670 | Federal | OW (P
RW 12-20B 20 | 0708 | 230E 4304715272 5670 | Federal |[OW |S
RW 12-28B 28 | 070S | 230E /4304715274 5670 | Federal OW |P
RW 32-26B 26 | 0708 | 230E 4304715275 5670 | Federal |GW |TA
RW 31-28B 28 | 070S | 230E |4304715283 5670 | Federal |OW |TA
RW 34-30B 30 | 070S | 230E [4304715288 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 23-26B 26 | 0708 | 230E 4304715290 5670 | Federal |GW |S
RW 41-33A 33 | 070S | 220F |4304715294 5670 | Federal |OW P
RW 43-24B 24 | 070S | 230E 4304715295 5670 | Federal | GW |TA
RW 12-14B 14 | 0708 | 230E 4304715296 5670 | Federal |OW |S
RW 32-28C 28 1 070S | 240F /14304715302 5670 | Federal |GW |P
|[RW 23-25A 25 1 070S | 220E (4304715305 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 41-8F 08 | 080S | 240F [4304720014 5670 | Federal |GW |P
RW 44-21C 21 10708 | 240E |4304730149 5670 | Federal | GW |S
RW 13-27B 27 | 0708 | 230E 4304730199 5670 | Federal OW |TA
RW 21-34B 34 | 070S | 230E |4304730258 5670 | Federal  OW |P
RW 43-26B 26 | 0708 | 230F 14304730259 5670 | Federal |OW |TA
RW 14-18C 18 | 070S | 240E |4304730309 5670 | Federal |OW P
RW 12-26B 26 | 0708 | 230E 4304730311 5670 | Federal |OW |TA
RW 32-24B 24 10708 | 230E 4304730313 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 34-18C 18 | 070S | 240E |4304730314 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 21-19C 19 | 070S | 240F (4304730340 5670 | Federal | GW |P
RW 14-25B 25 | 070S | 230E 4304730341 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 32-35B 35 10708 | 230E |4304730342 5670 | Federal [OW |TA
RW 12-36B 36 1070S | 230E 14304730344 5670 | Federal |OW |S
Bonds: BLM = ESB000024
BIA = 956010693
State = 965010695 2 of 4




Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
RED WASH
effective June 14, 2010

well_name sec| twp | g |api entity | mineral |type (stat |C
lease

RW 22-14B 14 1 0708 | 230E [4304730345 5670 | Federal [OW |P
RW 42-13B 13 10708 | 230E |4304730346 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 23-19C 19 | 070S | 240E |4304730348 5670 | Federal |GW |P
RW 22-18C 18 0708 | 240E 14304730387 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 22-17C 17 | 070S | 240F |4304730388 5670 | Federal | GW |P
RW 44-26B 26 | 070S | 230E 14304730520 5670 | Federal |GW |P
RW 42-27B 27 1 070S | 230E |4304731051 5670 | Federal | OW |TA
RW 44-27B 27 | 0708 | 230E 14304731053 5670 | Federal OW |TA
RW 44-23B 23 10708 | 230E |4304731054 5670 | Federal |GW |P
RW 11-35B 3510708 | 230E |4304731079 5670 | Federal | OW [P
RW 22-35B 35 10708 | 230E 14304731082 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 33-23B 23 1 070S | 230F 14304731476 5670 | Federal |GW |TA
RW 11-24B 24 | 070S | 230F 4304731477 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 42-21B 21 | 070S | 230E 14304731478 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 13-24B 24 1 070S | 230E |4304731517 5670 | Federal |[OW |P
RW 42-23B 23 | 070S | 230E (4304731576 5670 | Federal (GW |TA
RW 12-35B 35 10708 | 230E |4304731578 5670 | Federal |OW |S
RW 24-15B 15 | 0708 | 230E |4304731579 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 24-18C 18 | 070S | 240E [4304731582 5670 | Federal |GW |P
RW 43-15B 15 10708 | 230E 14304731682 17643 | Federal |GW |DRL |C
RW 34-17B 17 1 070S | 230E |4304731819 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 41-4F 04 | 080S | 240F /14304732538 5670 | Federal |GW |TA
RW 23-23C 23 | 0708 | 240F 4304732629 5670 | Federal | GW P
RW 14-17B 17 | 070S | 230E |4304732738 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 32-17B 17 1 070S | 230E /4304732981 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 32-18B 18 | 070S | 230E 14304733018 5670 | Federal OW |P
RW 42-20B 20 | 0708 | 230E 4304733490 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 22-20B 20 1 0708 | 230E 4304733491 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 24-19B 19 | 070S | 230E |4304733492 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 22-21B 21 10708 | 230E 4304733522 5670 | Federal OW |S
RW 24-20B 20 1 070S | 230E |4304733523 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 44-19B 19 | 0708 | 230E |4304733524 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 44-20B 20 | 0708 | 230E 4304733525 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 24-18B 18 | 070S | 230E 14304733554 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 42-19B 19 | 0708 | 230E 14304733556 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 22-19B 19 | 070S | 230E 4304733559 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 23-24A 24 | 0708 | 220E 4304733567 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 42-24A 24 1 070S | 220E 14304733569 5670 | Federal |OW P
RW 21-25A 25 | 0708 | 220F 4304733576 5670 | Federal [OW |P
RW 41-25A 25 {0708 | 220E (4304733579 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 21-24A 24 10708 | 220E 14304733592 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 44-18B 18 | 070S | 230E |4304733594 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 41-24A 24 | 0708 | 220E (4304733769 5670 | Federal | OW |P
RW 42-30B 30 | 070S | 230E 4304733771 5670 | Federal |OW |S

Bonds: BLM = ESB000024
BIA = 956010693
State = 965010695

3 0of 4




Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
RED WASH
effective June 14, 2010

well_name sec| twp | mg |api entity | mineral |type [stat |C
lease
RWU 44-30B 30 | 0708 | 230E |4304733772 5670 | Federal |OW P
RW 22-25A 25 | 070S | 220E |4304733786 5670 | Federal |OW |P
RW 34-27C 27 | 0708 | 240E 4304735045 5670 | Federal |GW |P
RW 34-22C 22 | 070S | 240E /14304735098 5670 | Federal | GW |P
RW 34-23AG 23 | 070S | 220E |4304735668 5670 | Federal |OW |P
. |[RWU 32-27AG 27 10708 | 220E (4304735670 5670 | Federal OW |P
RW 14-34AMU 34 | 0708 | 220E 4304735671 14277 | Federal |GW |P
RW 44-08FG 08 | 080S | 240E 4304736349 15261 | Federal |GW |P
RW 34-34 AD 34 10708 | 220F /14304736351 16177 | Federal |GW |P
RW 33-31 BD 31 10708 | 230E (4304736357 Federal | GW |APD |C
RW 13-31 BD 31 10708 | 230E |4304736358 Federal |GW |APD |C
RW 21-26AD 26 | 070S | 220E [4304736768 5670 | Federal |(OW |OPS |C
RW 43-26AG 26 | 0708 | 220F 4304736769 16575 | Federal | OW |OPS |C
RW 43-23AG 23 [ 0708 | 220E |4304736770 5670 | Federal | OW |OPS |C
RW 41-26AG 26 | 070S | 220E 4304736818 5670 | Federal |[OW |OPS |C
RW 04-25B 25 1 070S | 230E |4304736982 17224 | Federal | OW |P
RW 34-27ADR 27 | 070S | 220F |4304739445 16330 | Federal | GW |P
RW 32-29CD 29 | 070S | 240FE |4304739854 Federal |GW |APD |C
RW 24-10FD 10 | 080S | 240E (4304739963 Federal | GW |APD |C
RW 34-20CD 20 | 070S | 240E |4304739964 Federal |GW [APD '|C
RW 32-20CD 20 | 070S | 240E 14304739965 Federal |GW |APD
RW 24-21CD 21 | 070S | 240E 4304739966 Federal | GW |APD |C
RW 41-28CD 28 | 0708 | 240E [4304739967 Federal | GW |APD |C
RW 41-33CD 33 | 070S | 240E 14304739968 Federal |GW |APD |C
RW 14-35 AMU 35 10708 | 220E 4304740051 Federal | GW |APD |C
RW 44-35 AMU 35 10708 | 220E |4304740052 Federal |GW |APD
RW 12-17FG 17 | 080S | 240E 14304740602 Federal |GW _APD |C
Bonds: BLM = ESB000024
BIA = 956010693
State = 965010695 4 of 4




United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
http://www.blm.gov/ut/st/en.html]

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3100
(UT-922)
JUL 2 8 2010
Memorandum
To: Vemal Field Office, Price Field Office, Moab Field Office
From: Chief, Branch of Minerals /@l& L 'g
Subjeét: Name Change Recognized

TAKE Prioe’
NAMERICA

Attached is a copy of the Certificate of Name Change issued by the Texas Secretary of State and
a decision letter recognizing the name change from the Eastern States Office. We have updated

our records to reflect the name change in the attached list of leases.

The name change from Questar Exploration and Production Company into QEP Energy

Company is effective June 8, 2010.

ce: MMS
UDOGM

)




Federal Approval of this

Action is Necessary
API Well No: 43047151570000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING U 081 '
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
DRILL form for such proposals. RED WASH
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well RW 23-13B
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047151570000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext RED WASH
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH
1889 FSL 1924 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 13 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH
11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
|:| ACIDIZE |:| ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
/ NOTICE OF INTENT D D D
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
1/1/2011
|:| CHANGE WELL STATUS |:| COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
[l suBsEQUENT REPORT v' DEEPEN [J FRACTURE TREAT [J NEw consTRuCTION
Date of Work Completion:
|:| OPERATOR CHANGE |:| PLUG AND ABANDON |:| PLUG BACK
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
|:| SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: |:| REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION |:| SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT |:| WATER SHUTOFF |:| SI TA STATUS EXTENSION |:| APD EXTENSION
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER:
12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
QEP Energy Company requests approval to deepen the above well to a total
depth of 11,352' to the Mesaverde formation. In addition, the well pad has Approved by the
been modified to accomodate the larger drill rig and the surface use plan as Utah Division of
been revised to address all other changes. The ammended footages are: Oil, Gas and Mining
1882' FSL, 1920' FWL Please refer to the following plans: Surface Use Plan
8-Point Drilling Plan Plat Package Date: August 31, 2010

By: \ |

TN

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Jan Nelson 435 781-4331 Permit Agent
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 8/26/2010

RECEIVED_August 26, 2010
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API Number: 4304715157
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QEP ENERGY COMPANY

RW 23-13B Drilling Prog
API: 43-047-15157
Summarized Re-Entry Procedure

1. Clear location of all unnecessary equipment.
Ox MIRU pulling unit.

3. ND tubing head, NU BOP’s (3M).

4. Kill well if necessary.

5. POOH with existing production equipment.
6. Completions will prep well for re-entry.

7. POOH.

8. ND BOP’s

9. RD pulling unit, move off location.

10.  MIRU drilling rig.

11.  NUrig’s 5,000 WP rated BOP.

12. Drill out shoe and down to 11,352’ MD.

13, TOOH, and rig up logging truck.

14, Log well.

15. Circulate and condition hole, TOOH, LDDP.
16. RU casing crew and run 4 %4” casing.

17. RU cement crew and cement casing.

18. ND BOPE

19. RDMO.

RECEIVED August 26, 2010




ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY
RW 23-13B

DRILLING PROGRAM

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore
Federal Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil & Gas No. 1, and
the approved plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of its
subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to
insure compliance.

1. Formation Tops

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth, TVD & MD
Green River 3,030’

Mohagany 3,722°

Original TD 5,857

Wasatch 6,062’

Mesaverde 8,252’

Sego 10,677

Castlegate 11,302°

TD 11,352’

2, Anticipated Depths of Oil, Gas, Water, and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top an bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas,
or other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered as follows:

Substance Formation Depth, TVD & MD
Gas Wasatch 6,062°

Gas Mesaverde 8,252

Gas Sego 10,677

Gas Castlegate 11,302’

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling
will be recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be
tested to determine commercial potential.

Page 1 of 6
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ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY
RW 23-13B

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal,
Utah. Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If flows are
detected, samples will be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses
conducted. Fresh water will be obtained from Wonsits Valley water right A36125
(which was filed on May 7, 1964) or Red Wash water right # 49-2153 (which was
filed on March 25, 1960). It was determined by the Fish and Wildlife Service that
any water right number filed before 1989 is not depleting to the Upper Colorado
River System, to supply fresh water for drilling purposes. All water resulting
from drilling operations will be disposed of at Red Wash Central Battery Disposal
site; SWSE, Section 27, T7S, R23E or Wonsits Valley Disposal Site; SWNW,
Section 12, T8S, R21E.

3. Operator’s Specification for Pressure Control Equipment

A. 7 1/16” or 11” as available 5000 psi double ram with blind rams and pipe
rams, annular preventer and drilling spool or BOP with 2 side outlets.

B. All BOP connection subject to pressure shall be flanged, welded or clamped.

C. KXill line (2” min), 2 choke line valves (3” min), choke line (3” min), 2 kill line
valves (2” min) and a check valve, 2 chokes with one remotely controlled
from rig floor and a pressure gauge on choke manifold.

D. Upper and Lower Kelly cock valves with handles and safety valve and subs to
fit all drill string connections.

E. IBOP or float sub available.
F. Fill up line must be installed above the uppermost preventer.

G. Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved
stack working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 50 percent of internal
yield pressure of casing whichever is less. BOP and related equipment shall
meet the minimum requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 for
equipment and testing requirements, procedures, etc..., for a 5M system and
individual components shall be operable as designed.

Page 2 of 6
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ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY
RW 23-13B

4. Casing Design:

Hole Csg. Top | Bottom | Wt. Grade Thread | Cond. | Expected
Size Size | (MD) | (MD) MW (ppg)
133/4” | 103/4” | sfc 408' 40.5# J-55 STC | Existing N/A
9” 7" sfc 5,857 23# K-55 LTC | Existing N/A
61/8” | 412" sfc | 11,352' | 13.5# N-80 LTC New 8.8-9.6
Casing Strengths: Collapse Burst Tensile (min)
103/4” | 40.5# K-55 STC | 2,090 psi | 3,580 psi 493,000 Ib.
7" 23# J-55 LTC | 3,270 psi | 4,360 psi 313,000 1b.
41/2" 13.5# N-80 LTC | 8,540 psi | 9,020 psi 270,000 Ib.

Casing Design Factors

Burst: 1.4
Collapse: 1.3
Tension: 1.4

Anticipated Frac Pressure:

Cementing Program

Maximum anticipated mud weight:

4-1/2" Production Casing: sfc — 11,352’*

11 ppg (RW 34-34AD)
4,500 psi

Lead Slurry: 3,000° — 5,857 120 sks (294 ft’) Halliburton Light Premium, 0.2%
WG-17 (Gelling Agent), 0.2% CFR-3 (Dispersant), 0.2% HR-5 (Retarder) Slurry
Weight 11.5 1b/gal, 2.57 ft*/sk, 0% excess

Tail Slarry: 5,857° — 11,352". 390 sks (650 ft*) 50/50 Poz Premium Cement, 3
1b/sk Silicalite (Light Weight Additive), 0.2% Super CBL (Expander), 0.3% HR-5
(Retarder), 0.5% Halad-344 (Fluid Loss Control), 20% SSA-1 (Fluid Loss
Control), 0.3% CFR-3 (Dispersant), Slurry Weight 13.5 Ib/gal, 1.70 ft*/sk, 25%

excess over open hole portion

ccment to 3,000°.

Page 3 of 6
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ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY
RW 23-13B

6. Auxiliary Equipment

A. Kelly Cock — yes

B. Float at the bit — yes

C. Monitoring equipment on the mud system — PVT/Flow Show

D. Full opening safety valve on the rig floor — yes

E. Drilling below the 7” casing will be done with water based mud.
Maximum anticipated mud weight is 11 ppg.

F. No minimum quantity of weight material will be required to be kept on
location.

G. Gas detector will be used from intermediate casing depth to TD.

7. Testing, logging and coring program

A. Cores — Possible.
B. DST — none anticipated

C. Logging — Mud logging — Drill out to TD
GR-SP-Induction, Neutron Density.

D. Formation and Completion Interval:
— Stimulation will be designed for the particular area of interest as
encountered.
8. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential
Hazards

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. Maximum anticipated
bottom hole pressure equals approximately 6,517 psi. Maximum anticipated
bottom hole temperature is 210° F.

H2S has not been encountered in other wells drilled to similar depths in the
general area.

Page 4 of 6
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ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY
RW 23-13B
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ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP ENERGY COMPANY
RW 23-13B

A‘b SDUOTELY [FERATES CHOZE

5p CHOKE MANIFOULD EQUIPMENT - CONFIGURATION OF CHOKES MAY VARY

Altheugh o4 required box any of e choke umifeld cymems, Tulle okl &7 chidilied daes

u:-pu::mon:wmding m’l’- esd lines togedmr, When buffer tmks wy xsbeyed, wabvss st b instalind Ypmen £ ket o fajuare
o malfunclidn Withaut inemapriag floa cantrat. Thpugh nal chown un Jbt, 3ht, 10RE Q% 15M drawmgy, it wa0d o b2 appladis 0
o SHuationd.

[54 FR 39523, 5epl 27, 1967] -~
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Updaled MPG 7-9-2010

RW 23-13B
APl 43.047-15157
NESW Sec 13 778 R23E
Uintah County, Utah
KB 10-3/4" 40.54 J-55
GL5771 Set @ 408'
Original Spud: October, 1953
Perfs:
4642-48
4715-22
=
4929-48
4997-5020 o
5186' - 5797'
=
—
\ =
PBTD @ 5,810°
h TD@5857
7" 23# K-55 Set @ 5,857 61/8' OH
412 1358#N80 4 | 'Y

11,352 D
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QEP ENERGY COMPANY
RW 23-13B
1882' FSL 1920" FWL
NESW, SECTION 13, T7S, R23E
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
LEASE # UTU-081

ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1
MULTI - POINT SURFACE USE & OPERATIONS PLAN

An onsite inspection was conducted for the RW 23-13B on July 13, 2010. Weather conditions
were hot and sunny at the time of the onsite. In attendance at the inspection were the following individauls:

James Hereford Bureau of Land Management
Kevin Sadlier Bureau of Land Management
Holly Villa Bureau of Land Management
Jan Nelson QEP Energy Company
Stephanie Tomkinson QEP Energy Company

Guy Betts QEP Energy Company

Bob Haygood QEP Energy Company

Kelly Reyos QEP Energy Company

Dee Christensen QEP Field Service

McCoy Anderson Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying
1. [Existing Roads:
The proposed well site is approximately 25 miles Northeast of Vernal, Utah.

Refer to Topo Maps A and B for location of access roads within a 2 — mile radius.

All existing roads will be maintained and kept in good repair during all phases of operation.
2. Planned Access Roads:

Please refer to QEP Energy Company Greater Deadmen Bench EIS UTU-080-200-0369V
Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

Refer to Topo Map B for the location of the proposed access road.
No new access road is proposed. The access to be used is the access to the existing RW 23-13B location.
Graveling or capping the roadbed will be preformed as necessary to provide a well constructed safe road.

3. Location of Existing Wells Within a 1 — Mile Radius:

Please refer to Topo Map C.

4, Location of Existing & Proposed Facilities:

Please refer to QEP Energy Company Greater Deadmen Bench EIS UTU-080-200-0369V
Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

Refer to Topo Map D for the location of the proposed pipeline.
All existing pipelines and equipment will be moved off location before any construction begins.

Surface pipeline will be 6" or smaller.

It was determined on the onsite by the BLM VFO AO that the facilities will be painted Covert Green.

RECEIVED_August 26, 2010




Location and Type of Water Supply:

Please refer to QEP Energy Company Greater Deadmen Bench EIS UTU-080-200-0369V
Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

Water for drilling purposes would be obtained from Wonsits Valley Water Right # A 36125 (which
was filed on May 7, 1964) or Red Wash Water Right # 49-2153 (which was filed on March 25, 1960).
It was determined by the Fish and Wildlife Service that any water right number filed before 1989 is
not depleting to the Upper Colorado River System.

Source of Construction Materials:

Please refer to QEP Energy Company Greater Deadmen Bench EIS UTU-080-200-0369V
Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

Methods of Handling Waste Materials:

Please refer to QEP Energy Company Greater Deadmen Bench EIS UTU-080-200-0369V
Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

Ancillary Facilities:

Please refer to QEP Energy Company Greater Deadmen Bench EIS UTU-080-200-0369V
Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

Well Site Layout: (See Location Layout Diagram)

The attached Location Layout Diagram describes drill pad cross-sections, cuts and fills

and locations of the mud tanks, reserve pit, flare pit, pipe racks, trailer parking, spoil dirt
stockpile(s), and surface material stockpile(s).

Please see the attached diagram to describe rig orientation, parking areas, and access roads.

A pit liner is required. A felt pit liner will be required if bedrock is encountered.

Plans for Reclamation of the Surface:

Please refer to QEP Energy Company Uinta Basin Division Reclamation Plan

Site Specific Procedures:

Site Specific Reclamation Summary:

Reclamation will follow Questar Exploration and Production Company, Uinta Basin Division's Reclamation Plan,
September 2009 (Questar's Reclamation Plan) and the BLM Green River District Reclamation Guidelines.

All trash and debris will be removed from the disturbed area.

The disturbed area will be backfilled with subsoil.

Topsoil will be spread to an even, appropriate depth and disced if needed.

Water courses and drainages will be restored.

Erosion control devices will be installed where needed.

Seeding will be done in the fall, prior to ground freeze up.

Seed mix will be submitted to a BLM AO for approval prior to seeding.

Monitoring and reporting will be conducted as stated in Questar's Reclamation Plan. A reference site has been
establised and is included in this application.

It was determined and agreed upon that there is 6" inches of top soil.
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1.

12.

Surface Ownership:
Bureau of Land Management
170 South 500 East

Vernal, Utah 84078

(435) 781-4400

Other Information

A Class lll archaeological survey was conducted by Montgomery Archaeology Consultants.
A copy of this report was submitted on July 15, 2010, Moac Report No. 10-090 by
Montgomery Archaeology Consultants. Cultural resource clearance was recommended
for this location.

A Class lll paleontological survey was conducted by Intermountain Paleo Consulting. A copy of
this report was submitted on June 30, IPC # 10-66 by Stephen D. Sandau.

The inspection resulied in the location of no fossil resources. However, if vertebrate fossil(s) are found
during construction a paleontologist should be immediately notified. QEP will provide paleo monitor if needed.

RECEIVED_August 26, 2010




| QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

AV L R e =
RW #23-13B

LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
SECTION 13, T7S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

==ty ETR e g
T ol g . T ;"le"-"J”-"',-"'
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PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #5 TO LOCATION STAKE CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHERLY

EXISTING ACCESS

PHOTO: VIEW OF EXISTING ACCESS CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHEASTERLY

| 9o Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying LOCATION PHOTOS

Ran 85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078
- Since 1964 - (435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813

IO PHOTO
YEAR
REVISED: 00-00-00

DRAWN BY: J.H,
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QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

Well location, RW #23—13B, located as shown in

the NE 1/4 SW 1/4 of Section 13, T7S, R23E,
S.L.B.&M., Uintah County, Utah.

BASIS OF ELEVATION

BENCH MARK (20EAM) LOCATED IN THE SE 1/4 OF SECTION
35, T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE OURAY SE
QUADRANGLE, UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTE SERIES
(TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL SURVEY. SAID
ELEVATION IS MARKED AS BEING 4697 FEET.

BASIS OF BEARINGS
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.

[=] - [=]
S 8 = S
SCALE
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FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MED
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UNTAH ENGINEERING & Lawt'"'SURVEYING

85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL UTAH 84078
(435) 789-1017
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QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

LOCATION LAYOUT FOR

|FIGURE 47/

£ RW #23—13B
SECTION 13, T7S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.
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UINTAH ENCINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
85 So 200 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (435) 789-1017
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QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

X—Section

TYPICAL CROSS SECTION FOR

y
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Scale

DATE’";E‘(‘)’; . SECTION 13, T7S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.
DRAWN BY: S.L. 1882' FSL 1920 FWL
70’ 10'

RW #23—13B

Finish Grade| |
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E === o N
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APPROXIMATE ACREAGES
EXISTING WELL SITE DISTURBANCE = 2+ 0.680 ACRES

PROPOSED WELL SITE DISTURBANCE = % 0.369 ACRES
PROPOSED PIPELINE DISTURBANCE = + 2.040 ACRES

TOTAL = # 3.089 ACRES
EXCESS MATERIAL

APPROXIMATE YARDAGES

Topsoil & Flare Box

* NOTE:

FILL QUANTITY INCLUDES
5% FOR COMPACTION

130 Cu. Yds.
330 Cu Yds.

(6™) Topsoil Stripping = 230 Cu. Yds. Backfill
{New, Eonstubction 0a1y) l()1E/F:IZCI?OzN\éoA|\BANCE 200> ¢
L ' _ = <Z00> Cu Yds.
REneiningl [location = 950 Ci. Yds, (After Interim Rehabilitation)
TOTAL CUT = 1,780 CU.YDS. UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYINC
FILL 1,050 CU.YDS. 85 So 200 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (435) 7891017
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QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

TYPICAL RIG LAYOUT FOR

Access Road ~ {

UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYINC
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QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD. / FICURE § 47
INTERIM RECLAMATION PLAN FOR . r

RW #23-13B —
SECTION 13, T7S, R23E, S.L.B.&M. OSSLAND o,

(&) 1882' FSL 1920' FWL
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UINTAH ENCINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
85 So 200 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (435) 789-1017

RECEIVED August 26, 2010




QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

RW #23-13B
SECTION 13, T7S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY, THEN SOUTHERLY DIRECTION FROM VERNAL,
UTAH ALONG U.S. HIGHWAY 40 APPROXIMATELY 3.9 MILES TO THE
JUNCTION OF STATE HIGHWAY 45; EXIT RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 17.1 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF
THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE EAST; TURN LEFT AND
PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 4.3 MILES TO THE
JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE NORTHEAST;
TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN A NORTHEASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 23’ MILES TO THE PROPOSED LOCATION.

TOTAL DISTANCE FROM VERNAL, UTAH TO THE PROPOSED WELL
LOCATION IS APPROXIMATELY 25.3 MILES.

RECEIVED_August 26, 2010
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State of Utah OPERATOR ACCT. No. N-3700
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining OPERATOR: QEP Energy Company
ADDRESS: 11002 East 17500 South
ENTITY ACTION FORM - FORM 6 Vernal, Utah 84078  (435)781-4342
Action | Current | New Entity APE Number Well Name QQ SC | TP | RG County Spud Date Effective Date
Code | Entity No. No.
E 5670 ; 43-047-15157 | RW 23-13B NESW | 13 | 78 | 23E Uintah .
/1878 /390
WELL 1 COMMENTS: From GRRY to MVRD. ’
WELL 2 COMMENTS:
WELL 3 COMMENTS:
WELL 4 COMMENTS:
WELL 5 COMMENTS:
N . -

ACTION CODES (See instructions on back of form) |

A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) :

B - Add new well to existing entity (group or unit well) RECEIVED

C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity Slghature

D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity NOV 2 9 2010

E - Other (explain in comments section) Permit Agent 11/18/2010

Title Dat
DAV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING ' e

NOTE: Use COMMENT section to explain why each Action Code was selected

(3/89)

Phone No. (435)781-4342




API Well No: 43047151570000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
U-081

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
RED WASH

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
RW 23-13B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43047151570000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext RED WASH
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH
1882 FSL 1920 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 13 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING D CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
/ SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT D NEW CONSTRUCTION
2/5/20 1 1 D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT !/ PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT
. D WATER SHUTOFF D SI TA STATUS EXTENSION D APD EXTENSION
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER:

THIS WELL COMMENCED PRODUCTION ON 02/05/2011.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Jan Nelson 435 781-4331 Permit Agent
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 2/14/2011




STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

AMENDED REPORT [_]
(highlight changes)

FORM 8

DIVISION OF OIlL, GAS AND MINING 5, LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-081
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
1a. TYPE OF WELL: oL eas 7] R[] OTHER 7. ugg ;0 06\ ;g:e;mem NAME
b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Ve 1 RF O e ey [ RESVR OTHER RW 23-13B
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APl NUMBER:
QEP Energy Company 4304715157
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
1050 17th Street Ste 500 cirv Denver state CO  zp 80265 (303) 672-6900 Red Wash
4, LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) ‘ E e 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,
asureacE: 1889' FSL, 1924' FEL BRL fey ‘U\)Qd MERIDIA |
\DL) \,\c’_)m NWSE 13 78  23E
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVAL REPORTED BELOW:  Same
. 12. COUNTY 13. STATE
AT TOTALDEPTH: Seumg_ \L\‘bcb ‘F%\ \’QC\O &\ Uintah UTAH
""14. DATE SPUDDED: 15. DATE T.D. REACHED: |16, DATE COMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, GL):
11/11/2010 11/14/2010 2/2/2011 asanooneo [ ] reaoy o probuce 5771 - GL
18. TOTALDEPTH: MD {() 880 19, PLUG BACK T.D.. MD q 20. IF MULTIPLE COMPLETIONS, HOW MANY? * | 21. DEPTHBRIDGE ~ MD
’ PLUG SET:
™o 1088071 w o

22, TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICAL LOGS RUN (Submit copy of each) 4 23.

Quad Combo WAS WELL CORED?

vof/]  ves[]

{Submit analysis)

WAS DST RUN? NO ves[ ]  (Submitreport)
DIRECTIONAL SURVEY? no[ ] ves[/]  (submitcopy)
24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in well)
HOLE SIZE SIZEIGRADE WEIGHT () TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) | STACE CE TR voEL‘]kJAER(;BL) CEMENT ToP ** | AMOUNT PULLED
13 3/4" 10 3/4 J-55 40.5# 0 408 Ideal 180
9" ™ J-55 23# 0 5,850 Strata 300 1570 CBL
6 1/8" 41/2" 1-80 13.5# 0 10,874 G 520
25. TUBING RECORD
SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) | PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET(MD) | PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) | PACKER SET (MD)
2 3/8" 9,972
26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD
FORMATION NAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) | TOP (TVD) | BOTTOM (TvD) | INTERVAL (Top/Bot- MD) SIZE | NO. HOLES PERFORATION STATUS
) Mesa Verde 10,082 10,508 10,082 10.508| .5 126 |open [/] saueezea [_]

(B Open D Squeezed [___:I
(C) Open D Squeezed D
©

Open D Squeezed D

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNT AND TYPE OF MATERIAL

10,476' - 10,508

38.1 bbl 15% HCI, 3670 bbl slick water w/132,200 Ibs 30/50 sand

10,274’ - 10,286

19 bbl 15% HCI, 1374 bbil slick water w/ 26,400 Ibs 30/50 sand

10,084' - 10,098

19 bbl 15% HCI, 1560 bbl slick water w/ 52,800 Ibs 30/50 sand

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS:

] ELECTRICAUMECHANICAL LOGS

I:l SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGING AND CEMENT VERIFICATION

30, WELL STATUS:

] ostreport /] DIREGTIONAL SURVEY
m otuer: Drilling Report

[] eeorocic ReporT
[ core anaysis

Producing

(5/2000)

RECEIVED .
MAR 29 2011
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

{(CONTINUED ON BACK)



31. INITIAL PRODUCTION INTERVAL A {As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION |OIL-B8BL: GAS - MCF: WATER ~BBL: |PROD. METHOD:
2/5/2011 2/10/2011 24 RATES: = 0 1,390 122 Flowing
CHOKE S1ZE: |TBG. PRESS. |CSG.PRESS. JAPIGRAVITY |BTU-GAS GAS/OIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION |OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER —~BBL: |INTERVAL STATUS:
16/64 RATES: = 0 1,390 122
INTERVAL B (As shown in item #26)
DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION |OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER -BBL: |PROD. METHOD:
RATES: —
CHOKE SIZE: {TBG.PRESS. [CSG.PRESS. |APIGRAVITY |BTU-GAS GAS/OIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION JOIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER ~BBL: |INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: —

INTERVAL C (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION |OIL - BBL: GAS ~ MCF: WATER - BBL: |PROD. METHOD:
RATES: =

CHOKE SIZE: |TBG.PRESS. [|CSG.PRESS. [APIGRAVITY |BTU-GAS GAS/OIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION |OIL ~ BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: |INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES. —

INTERVAL D {As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION JOIL-BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER -BBL: {PROD. METHOD:
RATES: =

CHOKE SIZE: |TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. |APIGRAVITY 1BTU-GAS GAS/OIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION JOIL - BBL: GAS ~ MCF: WATER - BBL: |INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: —

32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Soid, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

33. SUMMARY OF POROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION (Log) MARKERS:

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Formation (L?g) B&;‘ST Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (Measu.:::t’; Depth)
Green River 3,030
Wasatch 6,052
Mesa Verde 8,196

35, ADDITIONAL REMARKS {Include plugging procedure)

36. | hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records.

NAME (PLEASE Priny_Morgan Anderson nmie Regulatory Affairs Analyst

sowrore Y YN A ol e 312212011
U

This report must be submitted within 30 days of

e completing or plugging a new well ® reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
e drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore e significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
o recompleting to a different producing formation e drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM 20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from two or more formations.

**|TEM 24: Cement Top — Show how reported top(s) of cement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL), cement bond log (CBL), temperature survey (TS)).

Send to: Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(5/2000)



SAED,

acr
e o RW 23-13B Native Def. Gyro Survey Survey Report
Report Date: March 3, 2011 Survey | DLS Computation Method:  Minimum Curvature / Lubinski
Client: QEP ENERGY Vertical Section Azimuth: 122.320°
Field: Uinta Vertical Section Origin: N 0.000 ft, E 0.000 ft
Structure ! Slot:  Red Wash / RW 23-13B TVD Reference Datum: KB
Well: RW 23-13B TVD Reference Elevation: 5785.2 ft relative to MSL.
Borehole: Re-Entry Sea Bed / Ground Level Elevation: 5643.300 ft relative to MSL
UWUAPI#: Magnetic Declination: 11.073°
Survey Name / Date: RW 23-13B Native Def. Gyro Survey / December 23, 2010 Total Field Strength: 52513.309 nT
Tort/ AHD / DDI/ERD ratio:  50.875° /810.36 ft/ 4.618/0.076 Magnetic Dip:  66.094°
Grid Coordinate System: NADS3 Utah State Planes, Central Zone, US Feet Declination Date: December 23, 2010
Location Lat/Long: N 40 12 26,810, W 109 16 40.830 Magnetic Declination Model: IGRF 2010
Location Grid N/E YIX: N 7251996.346 ftUS, E 2260935.101 fiUS North Reference: True North
Grid Convergence Angle: +1.42336030° Total Corr Mag North -> True North:  +11.073°
Grid Scale Factor: 0,99991990 Local Coordinates Referenced To: _ Well Head
Comments M?:put:‘ed Inclination Azimuth VD \SI::;ﬂﬁ?nl NS EW DLS Northing Easting Latitude Longitude
(ft) (deg) {deg) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) {deg/00ft) (ftus) (ftUS)
Tie-In 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 7251996.35 2260935.10 N 401226.810 W 109 16 40.830
39.00 0.64 336.50 39.00 -0.18 0.20 -0.09 164 7251996.54 2260935.01 N 401226.812 W 109 16 40,831
114.00 0.71 336.10 113.99 -0.91 1.01 -0.44 0.09 7251997.34 2260934.63 N 4012 26.820 W 109 16 40.836
214.00 0.62 326.33 213.99 -1.92 2.03 -0.99 0.14 7251998.35 2260934.06 N 40 1226.830 W 109 16 40.843
314.00 0.57 308.64 313.98 -2.91 2.79 -1.68 0.19 7251999.09 2260933.35 N 40 12 26.838 W 109 16 40.852
414.00 0.83 320.77 413.97 ~4.05 3.72 -2.43 0.36  7252000.01 2260932.57 N 40 12 26.847 W 109 16 40.861
514.00 1.22 352.14 513.96 -5.38 5.40 -2.95 0.55 7252001.67 2260932.02 N 4012 26.863 W 109 16 40.868
614.00 1.34 339.60 613.93 -6.99 7.55 -3.50 0.30 7252003.81 2260931.42 N 4012 26.885 W 109 16 40.875
714.00 1.20 326.48 713.91 -8.88 9.52 -4.48 0.32 725200575 2260930.38 N 40 12 26.904 W 109 16 40.888
814.00 1.07 310.60 813.89 -10.76 11.00 -5.77 0.34 7252007.20 2260929.06 N 401226.919 W 109 16 40.904
914.00 0.93 305.05 913.87 -12.49 12.08 -7.14 0.17 7252008.24 2260927.66 N 4012 26.929 W 109 16 40.922
1014.00 0.75 306.86 1013.86 -13.96 12.94 -8.33 0.18 7252009.07 2260926.45 N 4012 26.938 W 109 16 40.937
1114.00 0.76 315.84  1113.86 -15.25 13.80 -9.32 0.12 7252009.91 226092544 N 40 12 26.946 W 109 16 40.950
1214.00 0.81 327.07 1213.85 -16.54 14.87 -10.16 0.16  7252010.96 2260924.57 N 40 12 26.957 W 109 16 40.961
1314.00 0.56 329.17 1313.84 -17.62 15.89 -10.80 0.25 7252011.96 2260923.91 N 40 12 26.967 W 109 16 40.969
1414.00 0.38 331.44  1413.84 -18.35 16.60 -11.21 0.18 7252012.66 2260923.49 N 40 1226.974 W 108 16 40.974
1514.00 0.36 316.31  1513.83 -18.94 17.12 -11.58 0.10  7252013.17 2260923.10 N 401226.979 W 109 16 40.979
1614.00 0.29 303.30 1613.83 -19.50 17.48 -12.01 0.10 7252013.52 2260922.66 N 40 12 26.983 W 109 16 40.985
1714.00 0.14 299.28 1713.83 -19.87 17.68 -12.33 0.15 7252013.71 2260922.34 N 4012 26.985 W 109 16 40.989
1814.00 0.05 347.93  1813.83 -20.03 17.78 -12.45 0.11  7252013.81 2260922.22 N 4012 26.986 W 109 16 40.990
1914.00 0.17 23.1 1913.83 -20.08 17.96 -12.40 0.13 725201399 2260922.26 N 40 1226.987 W 109 16 40.990
2014.00 0.20 76.00 2013.83 -19.98 18.14 -12.17 0.17 7252014.18 2260922.49 N 4012 26.989 W 109 16 40.987
2114.00 0.09 3495 2113.83 -19.86 18.25 -11.95 0.14 725201429 226092270 N 401226.990 W 109 16 40.984
2214.00 0.12 8.35 2213.83 -19.90 18.41 -11.89 0.06 7252014.46 2260922.75 N 401226.992 W 109 16 40.983
2314.00 0.11 147.70 2313.83 -19.85 18.44 -11.83 0.22 7252014.48 2260922.82 N 4012 26.992 W 109 16 40.982
2414.00 0.48 176.27 2413.83 -19.52 17.94 -11.75 0.39 7252013.99 2260922.91 N 4012 26.987 W 109 16 40.981
2514.00 0.48 206.06 2513.83 -19.23 17.14 -11.91 0.25 7252013.19 2260822.77 N 40 1226.979 W 109 16 40.983
2614.00 0.60 197.71  2613.82 -19.05 16.27 -12.25 0.14 7252012.30 2260922.45 N 4012 26.971 W 109 16 40.988
2714.00 0.65 201.06  2713.81 -18.81 15.24 -12.61 0.06 7252011.27 2260922.11 N:401226.961 W 109 16 40.993
2814.00 0.71 202.78 2813.81 -18.59 14.14 -13.06 0.068 7252010.16 2260921.70 N 4012 26.950 W 109 16 40.998
2914.00 0.77 202.57 2913.80 -18.38 12.95 -13.55 0.06 7252008.95 2260921.23 N 4012 26.938 W 109 16 41.005
3014.00 1.01 213.52 3013.79 -18.28 11.59 -14.30 0.29 7252007.58 2260920.52 N 40 1226.925 W 109 16 41.014
3114.00 0.78 23217  3113.78 -18.53 10.44 -15.32 0.37 7252006.40 2260919.52 N 4012 26.913 W 109 16 41.027
3214.00 0.51 234.76  3213.77 -18.93 9.77 -16.22 0.27 725200571 2260918.64 N 40 1226.907 W 109 16 41.039
3314.00 047 224.33  3313.77 -19.19 9.22 -16.87 0.10  7252005.14 2260918.00 N 4012 26.901 W 109 16 41.047
3414.00 0.44 216.42 3413.76 -19.30 8.61 -17.39 0.07 7252004.52 2260917.50 - N 40 12 26.895 W 109 16 41.054
3514.00 0.42 175.76  3513.76 -19.11 7.94 -17.59 0.30 7252003.85 2260917.32 N 4012 26.838 W 109 16 41.057
3614.00 0.63 158.66 3613.76 -18.45 7.06 -17.36 0.26 7252002.97 2260917.57 N 40 12 26.880 W 109 16 41.054
3714.00 0.72 146.12 3713.75 -17.43 6.03 -16.81 0.17 7252001.95 2260918.15 N 40 12 26.870 W 109 16 41.047
3814.00 0.94 128.08 3813.74 -16.04 5.00 -15.82 0.34 7252000.95 2260919.17 N 40 12 26.859 W 109 16 41.034
3914.00 1.04 129.34 3913.72 -14.32 3.92 -14.47 0.10 7251999.90 2260920.54 N 4012 26.849 W 109 16 41.016
4014.00 1.05 12490  4013.71 -12.51 2.82 -13.02 0.08 7251998.84 2260922.02 N 40 1226.838 W 109 16 40.998
4114.00 0.99 126.88 4113.69 -10.73 1.78 -11.57 0.07 7251997.84 2260923.49 N 40 12 26.828 W 109 16 40.979
4214.00 0.83 121.66 4213.68 -9.15 0.88 -10.27 0.18 7251996.97 2260924.82 N 40 12 26.819 W 109 16 40.962
4314.00 0.58 123.09 4313.67 -7.91 0.22 -9.23 0.25 7251996.34 226092587 N 40 1226.812 W 109 16 40.949
4414.00 0.29 147.00  4413.67 -7.18 -0.27 -8.66 0.34 7251995.86 2260926.45 N 40 1226.807 W 109 16 40.942
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Last Gyro

To MD

4514.00
4614.00
4714.00
4814.00

4914.00
5014.00
5114.00
5214.00
5314.00

5414.00
5514.00
5614.00
5714.00
5814.00

5914.00
6014.00
6114.00
6214.00
6314.00

6414.00
6514.00
6614.00
6714.00
6814.00

6914.00
7014.00
7114.00
7214.00
7314.00

7414.00
7514.00
7614.00
7714.00
7814.00

7914.00
8014.00
8114.00
8214.00
8314.00

8414.00
8514.00
8614.00
8714.00
8814.00

8914.00
9014.00
9114.00
9214.00
9314.00

9414.00
9514.00
9614.00
9714.00
9814.00

9914.00
10014.00
10114.00
10214.00
10314.00

10414.00
10514.00
10614.00
10714.00
10792.00

10880.00

0.19
0.32
0.39
0.37

0.33
0.39
0.3¢
0.54
0.79

1.02
1.24
1.28
1.23
1.18

0.96
0.85
0.97
1.24
1.56

1.92
1.94
1.91
2.1
2.03

245
2.62
3.14
3.56
3.38

3.55
3.69
3.99
4.29
4.73

5.91
7.86
10.30
12.77
14.59

16.73
16.47
17.41
17.87
17.51

16.44
15.58
14.45
13.63
13.32

13.09
12.65
11.73
11.00
10.83

11.25
10.15
10.05
11.16
12.12

13.04
13.04
13.20
13.25
12.67

12.67
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181.21
225.85
240.53
239.13

215.75
215.83
174.29
146.90
129.97

136.00
129.40
118.85
114.57

99.03

88.34
64.29
39.56
49.85
54.76

53.80
58.02
69.05
77.29
81.52

79.14
91.47
94.53
101.43
106.85

109.35
113.15
117.12
121.38
128.01

128.43
130.23
130.68
129.88
128.95

129.43
129.60
125.85
125.06
125.35

126.47
127.38
12717
127.20
125.73

124.50
122.91
117.10
115.44
112.99

114.88
115.63
120.70
126.09
129.14

129.65
124.13
121.93
120.54
119.82

119.82
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4613.67
4713.66
4813.66

4913.66
5013.66
5113.66
5213.65
5313.65
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5613.59
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5813.54
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6713.23
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8108.92
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8782.88
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8974.64
9071.22
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9265.48
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9460.33
9558.08
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9754.31

9852.46
9950.72
10049.17
10147.46
10245.40
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10440.43
10537.82
10635.17
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-6.86
-6.84
-7.07
-7.38

-7.54
-7.58
-7.39
-6.75
-5.64

-4.09
-2.15
0.04
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4.23
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7.45
7.89
8.73

9.86
11.21
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15.24
17.88

20.78
24.30
28.69
34.01
39.75

45.61
51.80
58.45
65.65
73.49

82.71
94.61
110.23
130.03
153.50

179.46
206.98
235.97
266.23
296.58

325.71
353.20
379.01
403.19
426.43

449.24
471.51
492.58
51217
530.92

549.86
568.28
585.76
604.14
624.22

645.83
668.30
690,99
713.86
731.34

750.63
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-1.00
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-7.20
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-9.81
-8.84
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-2.35
-0.85
0.15
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1.82
1.55
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-7.78
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-29.15
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-232.27
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-391.67

-401.27

-8.53
-8.73
-9.23
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-10.25
-10.62
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-8.56
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-5.29
-3.33
-1.34

0.51
2.02
3.23
4.59
6.53
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11.78
14.77
18.13
21.67

25.52
29.91
34.92
40.70
46.56

52.30
58.18
64.24
70.53
76.97

84.25
93.51
105.51
120.77
139.05

159.32
180.71
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228.44
253.27

276.92
298.97
319.59
338.92
357.65

376.34
394.86
413.10
430.77
448.03

465.53
482.32
497.77
513.10
529.06
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563.91
582.94
602.50
617.62

634.37

0.17
0.23
0.1
0.02

0.15
0.06
0.28
0.26
0.32

0.25
0.26
0.24
0.11
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0.30
0.39
0.41
0.33
0.34

0.36
0.14
0.37
0.35
0.17

0.43
0.57
0.54
0.58
0.37

0.23
0.28
0.40
0.43
0.68

1.18
1.86
2.44
2.48
1.83

1.15
0.74
1.44
0.52
0.37

1.12
0.90
1.13
0.82
0.46

0.36
0.56
1.53
0.80
0.49

0.55
1.1
0.89
1.49
1.14

0.93
1.25
0.52
0.32
0.77

0.00

7251995.49
7251995.12
7251994.75
7251994.40

7251993.99
7251993.47
7251992.86
7251992.13
7251991.31

7251990.26
7251988.97
7251987.79
7251986.85
7251986.29

7251986.20
7251986.59
7251987.59
7251988.97
7251990.50

7251992.34
7251994.29
7251995.86
7251996.94
7251997.70

7251998.46
7251998.91
7251998.76
7251998.07
7251996.75

7251995.01
7251992.87
7251990.17
7251986.79
7251982.47

7251976.91
7251969.53
7251959.58
7251947.05
7251932.51

7251916.49
7251899.38
7251882.16
7251865.21
7251848.31

7251831.79
7251815.78
7251800.61
7251786.43
7251773.05

7251760.38
7251748.48
7251738.36
7251730.07
725172274

7251715.40
7251707.90
7251700.02
7251690.25
7251678.33

7251664.93
7251651.85
7251639.96
7251628.59
7251620.17

7251610.99

2260926.59
2260926.40
2260925.91
2260925.34

2260924.91
2260924.55
2260924.40
2260924.71
2260925.52

2260926.69
2260928.18
2260930.02
2260932.00
2260934.01

2260935.87
2260937.36
2260938.55
2260939.88
2260941.78

2260944.20
2260946.94
2260949.89
2260953.22
2260956.75

2260960.58
2260964.95
2260969.97
2260975.76
2260981.66

2260987.45
2260993.38
2260999.51
2261005.88
2261012.43

2261019.86
2261029.30
2261041.55
2261057.13
2261075.77

2261096.44
2261118.26
2261141.74
2261166.86
2261192.11

2261216.18
2261238.63
2261259.63
2261279.31
2261298.38

2261317.39
2261336.21
2261354.71
2261372.58
2261390.03

2261407.72
2261424.70
2261440.35
2261455.92
2261472.18

2261489.35
2261507.70
2261527.03
2261546.88
2261562.21

2261579.19

N 40 12 26.804
N 40 12 26.800
N 40 12 26.796
N 4012 26.793

N 40 12 26.789
N 40 12 26.784
N 4012 26.778
N 40 12 26.771
N 40 12 26.763

N 40 12 26.752
N 40 12 26.739
N 40 12 26.727
N 40 12 26.717
N 40 12 26.711

N 40 12 26.710
N 4012 26.713
N 4012 26.723
N 40 12 26.736
N 40 12 26.751

N 40 12 26.768
N 40 12 26.787
N 40 12 26.802
N 40 12 26.811
N 40 12 26.818

N 40 12 26.825
N 40 12 26.828
N 40 12 26.825
N 40 12 26.817
N 40 12 26.803

N 40 12 26.784
N 40 12 26.761
N 40 12 26.733
N 40 12 26.698
N 40 12 26.654

N 40 12 26.597
N 40 12 26.522
N 40 12 26.421
N 40 12 26.293
N 40 12 26.145

N 40 12 25.981
N 40 12 25.807
N 40 12 25.631
N 40 12 25.457
N 40 12 25.284

N 40 12 25.115
N 40 12 24.952
N 40 12 24.796
N 40 12 24.652
N 40 12 24.515

N 40 12 24.385
N 40 12 24.263
N 40 12 24.158
N 40 12 24.072
N 40 12 23.995

N 40 12 23.918
N 40 12 23.840
N 40 12 23.758
N 40 12 23.658
N 40 12 23.536

N 40 12 23.400
N 40 12 23.266
N 40 12 23.144
N 40 12 23.026
N 40 12 22.939

N 4012 22.845

W 109 16 40.940
W 109 16 40.943
W 109 16 40.949
W 109 16 40.956

W 109 16 40.962
W 109 16 40.967
W 109 16 40.969
W 109 16 40.965
W 109 16 40.955

W 108 16 40.940
W 109 16 40.922
W 109 16 40.898
W 109 16 40.873
W 109 16 40.847

W 109 16 40.823
W 109 16 40.804
W 109 16 40.788
W 108 16 40.771
W 109 16 40.746

W 109 16 40.714
W 109 16 40.678
W 109 16 40.640
W 109 16 40.596
W 109 16 40.551

W 109 16 40.501
W 109 16 40.445
W 109 16 40.380
W 109 16 40.305
W 109 16 40.230

W 109 16 40.156
W 108 16 40.080
W 109 16 40.002
W 109 16 39.921
W 109 16 39.838

W 109 16 39.744
W 109 16 39.625
W 109 16 39.470
W 109 16 39.273
W 109 16 39.038

W 109 16 38.777
W 109 16 38.501
W 109 16 38.204
W 109 16 37.886
W 109 16 37.566

W 109 16 37.261
W 109 16 36.977
W 109 16 36.711
W 109 16 36.462
W 109 16 36.220

W 109 16 35.980
W 109 16 35.741
W 109 16 35.506
W 109 16 35.278
W 109 16 35.055

W 108 16 34.830
W 109 16 34.614
W 109 16 34.414
W 109 16 34.217
W 109 16 34.011

W 108 16 33.794
W 109 16 33.562
W 109 16 33.317
W 109 16 33.065
W 109 16 32.870

W 109 16 32.654
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Survey Type: Definitive Survey

Survey Error Model: SLB ISCWSA version 22 *** 3-D 95.00% Confidence 2.7955 sigma
Surveying Prog:

MD From ( ft )} MD To (ft) EOU Freq Survey Tool Type Borehole -> Survey
0.00 141.90  Act-Stns SLB_CNSG+CASING-Depth Only Re-Entry -> RW 23-13B Native Def. Gyro Survey
141.90 10792.00  Act-Stns SLB_CNSG+CASING Re-Entry -> RW 23-13B Native Def. Gyro Survey

*Italicized stations are NOT used in position calculations.
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Prep for we- Entry
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RWU 23-13B ( 30)

Spud Date:  10/12/1953

Location: 13-7-S 23-E 26 Rig Release: 11/3/2010
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: #4
Date From-To | Hours | Code C;S:dbe Description of Operations
10/5/2010  [11:30 - 13:30 2.00/LOC |3 10/5/2010 ROAD RIG FROM YARD TO LOCATION 45 MILES
13:30 - 15:00 150/ LOC |4 SPOT IN RIG UP
15:00 - 16:30 1.50| OTH SOPT IN EQUIPMENT RUN PUMP LINES BLEED TBG OFF
16:30 - 17:30 1.00|TRP |6 UNSEAT ROD PUMP LD 1 - 1"X 6" SUB & 2 - 3/4" SLICK RODS CLOSE WELL IN
FOR NIGHT
17:30 - 19:00 1,50/ TRAV |1 CREW TRAVEL
10/6/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 10/6/2010, CREW TRAVEL CHECK SICP 800 SITP 200 OPEN WELL UP TO
FLOW BACK TANK
07:00 - 07:30 0.50|RIG 7 RIG UP HOT OILER FLUSH TBG 35 BBLS, RIG SAFTEY MEETING
07:30 - 08:00 0.50| OTH PICK UP 2-3/4" SILCK RODS SEAT ROD PUMP FILL AND TEST WITH 30BBLS
TEST TO 1000 PSI GOOD TEST
08:00 - 10:30 250|TRP |6 POOH LD RODS 164 - 3/4" SLICK
10:30 - 10:45 0.25|HOT |1 FLUSH TBG 10 BBLS
10:45 - 11:00 0.25/TRP |6 POOH LD 38 - 3/4" SLICK RODS AND ROD PUMP
11:00 - 11:30 0.50{ OTH CHANGE OVER TO TBG EQUIPMENT GET READY TO ND WELL HEAD AND
FLOW LINES
11:30 - 17:00 5.50| WOT |4 WAIT ON BOPS TO GET TO LOCATION, SHUT WELL IN FOR NIGHT
17:00 - 18:30 1.50| TRAV |1 CREW TRAVEL, TOTAL BBLS PUMP TODAY 75BBLS
10/7/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50] TRAV |1 10/7/2010, CREW TRAVEL
07:00 - 07:30 0.50| RIG 7 SAFTEY MEETING CHECK SICP 30 SITP VAC OPEN WELL UP TO FLOW BACK
TANK
07:30 - 10:00 2.50/BOP |1 ND WELL HEAD NU BOPS RELEASE TAC RIG UP FLOOR AND TBG TONGS
HAD A HARD TIME RELEASING TAC
10:00 - 12:30 2.50| TRP |1 POOH WITH TBG 172 JNTS 2 7/8" AND 1-2' 2 7/8" SUB 7" TAC PSN 1 JNT 2 7/8"
& NC, LD SUB, TAC, NC
12:30 - 14:30 2.00{TRP |2 MAKE UP 6 1/8" BIT& 7" SCRAPER & BALL TEST SUB TRIP IN WITH 175 JNTS 2
7/8" TBG TALLY PICK UP
14:30 - 17:00 2.50|{CIRC {1 RIG UP PUMP TO CASING UP TBG PUMP 80 BBL TO GET CIRC PUMP 197 TO
ROLL HOLE CLEAN
17:00 - 17:30 0.50|CIRC |1 BROP BALL DOWN TBG PUMP 30 BBLS TEST TO 3000 PS| GOOD TEST ROLL
BALL OUT OF TBG CLOSE WELL IN FOR NIGHT
17:30 - 19:00 1.50| TRAV |1 CREW TRAVEL, TOTAL BBLS LOST TODAY 127
10/8/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 10/8/2010, CREW TRAVEL
07:00 - 07:30 0.50 | RIG 7 SAFTEY MEETING CHECK SICP VAC SITP VAC OPEN WELL UP
07:30 - 09:30 2.00{TRP |1 POOH WITH 174 JNTS 2 7/8" TBG LD BIT & SCRAPER AND BALL TEST SUB
09:30 - 11:00 150/ TRP |2 MAKE UP 32A PKR TRIP IN THE HOLE WITH 149 JNTS SET PKR AT 4395'
11:00 - 12:30 150 EQT {1 FILL WITH 57 BBLS TEST TO 1500 PSI GOOD TEST LOST 0 PSI IN 5 MIN
12:30 - 13:30 1.00| TRP |14 RELEASE PKR TRIP IN 17 JNTS, MAKE UP STRIPING RUBBER SET PKR AT
4862'
13:30 - 16:00 2.50|CIRC |1 GET INJECTION RATE DOWN TBG PUMP 20 BBLS TO FILL. PUMP 10 AT 600
PSI 2 1/4 BBL PER MIN. PUMP DOWN CASING 20 BBLS TO FILL, PUMP 10
BBLS AT 900 PSI AT 2 BBLS PER MIN CLOSE WELL IN FOR WEEKEND CLEAN
uP
16:00 - 17:30 1.50| TRAV |1 CERW TRAVEL, TOTAL BBLS PUMP TO DAY 117
10/11/2010  |06:30 - 08:00 1.50| TRAV |1 10/11/2010, CREW TRAVEL
08:00 - 08:30 0.50| RIG 7 SAFETY MEETING CHECK SICP VAC SITP VAC OPEN WELL UP
08:30 - 10:00 1.50|CMT |1 RIG UP HALLIBURTON
10:00 - 10:30 0.50|CIRC |3 PUMP 80.5 BBLS DOWN CASING
10:30 - 13:00 250|CMT |3 GET INJECTION RATE 2 BBLS PER MIN AT 600 PSI| SQUEEZE PERFS AT

4929'-5020' WITH 125 SACKS OF 3 NEAT CEMENT 29 BBLS DISPLACE ISIP
2050 WATCH FOR 1/2 HR PSI AT 1200 PUMP 1/2 BBL ISIP 2500 WATCH FOR 15
MIN PSI DOWN TO 1400 BLEED BACK 3/4 BBL PUMP 1 BBL BACK IN IT ISIP
2000 WACH 15MIN PSI AT 1600 BLEED OFF REC 0 BBLS
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RWU 23-13B ( 30)

Spud Date:  10/12/1953

Location:  13-7-S 23-E 26 Rig Release: 11/3/2010
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: #4
Sub T )
Date From-To | Hours| Code Code Description of Operations
10/11/2010  |13:00 - 13:30 0.50|DEQ |2 RELEASE 32A PKR PULL 11 JNTS SET PKR AT 4539.5 FILL CASING 10 BBLS
13:30 - 15:00 150/ CMT |3 GET INJECTION RATE 2 BBLS PER MIN AT 1000 PSI FOR 10 BBLS SQUEEZE
PERFS AT 4642'-4722' WITH 3 NEAT CEMENT 75 SACKS DIS PLACE 25 BBLS
ISIP 1000 WATCH 15 MIN PSI AT 400 PUMP 1 BBLS ISIP 1000 WATCH 1/2 HR
PSI AT 650 PUMP 1 BBL ISIP 1300 WATCH FOR 1/2 HR PSI AT 650 BLEED OFF
REC 1 BBL
15:00 - 15:30 0.50|CIRC |1 REV CIRC 45 BBLS
15:30 - 16:00 0.50,DEQ |2 RELEASE PKR PULL 10 JNTS SET PKR AT 4274' PSI SQUEEZE UP TO 1800
ISIP CLEAN UP
16:00 - 16:30 0.50{CMT |1 RIG DOWN HALLIBURTON CLOSE WELL IN FOR NIGHT
16:30 - 18:00 1.50| TRAV |1 CREW TRAVEL
10/12/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV {1 10/12/2010, CREW TRAVEL
07:00 - 07:30 0.50| RIG 7 SAFETY MEETING CHECK SICP 0 SITP 30 RIG UP PUMP
07:30 - 09:00 150 EQT |1 TEST SQUEEZE TO 1500 PSI FOR 5 MIN LOST 600 PSI. TEST CASING ABOVE
PKR TO 1500 PSI LOST 0 IN 5 MIN
09:00 - 12:30 350|TRP |5 RELEASE PKR POOH LD 2 7/8" TBG 172 JNTS LD PKR
12:30 - 16:30 400(TRP |5 CHANGE OVER ELEVATORS TALLY PHE MAKE UP 6 1/8" BIT AND BIT SUB
PICK PH6 TRIP IN THE HOLE WITH 82 JNTS EOT AT 2600' CLOSE WELL IN
FOR NIGHT CLEAN UP
16:30 - 18:00 1.50| TRAV |1 CREW TRAVEL
10/13/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 10/13/2010, CREW TRAVEL
07:00 - 07:15 0.25|RIG 7 SAFETY MEETING CHECK SICP 0 SITP 0
07:15 - 07:30 0.25/CIRC |1 ROLL THE THE HOLE WITH 40 BBLS DOWN CASING UP TBG
07:30 - 08:00 0.50| EQT |1 TEST SQUEEZE TO 1000 PSI FOR 5 MIN LOST 80 PS! BLEED OFF
08:00 - 10:00 200(TRP |5 TALLY PICK UP PH6 TRIP IN THE HOLE WITH 64 JNTS TAG AT 4552.4' MAKE
UP STRIPPING RUBER
10:00 - 11:30 1.50{SEQ |1 RIG UP POWER SWIVEL
11:30 - 16:00 450(DRL |4 TAG UP START DRILLING OUT CEMENT JNT#1 DOWN TO 4550’ JNT#2 AT 1:26
DOWN TO 4584' INT#3 AT 1:55 DOWN TO 4615' INT#4 AT 2:25 DOWN TO
4646.5' INT#5 AT 2:57 DOWN TO 4678' INT#6 3:24 DOWN TO 4710' THE LAST
2' FELL THROUGH JNT# 7 AT 3:51 DOWN TO 4741' VERY RATTIE CEMENT
LAST 10' WAS FREE JNT#8 AT 4:08 DOWN TO 4773'
16:00 - 17:30 1.50|CIRC |1 ROLL HOLE CLEAN WITH 178 BBLS. TEST SQUEEZE TO 500 PSI FOR 5MIN
LOST 25 PSI, EOT AT 4773' CLOSE WELL IN FOR NIGHT CLEAN UP
17:30 - 19:00 1.50| TRAV |1 CREW TRAVE, 10 BBLS LOST TO DAY
10/14/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 10/14/2010,CREW TRAVEL
07:00 - 07:15 0.25|RIG 7 SAFETY MEETING CHECK SICP 0 SITP 0 TEST SQUEEZE TO 500 PIS LOST 75
PSIIN 5 MIN
07:15-10:30 325/DRL |4 TRIP IN TAG UP AT 4859' START DRILLING OUT CEMENT JNT#9 AT 7:20
DOWN TO 4869' JNT# 10 AT 7:50 DOWN TO 4900' JNT#11 AT 8:20 DOWN TO
4931' INT#12 AT 8:44 DOWN TO 4962' INT#13 AT 9:10 DOWN TO 4993’ JNT#14
AT 9:43 DOWN TO 5025' JNT#15 AT 10:15 DRILL UP 5' CEMENT FALL THOUGH
DOWN TO 5052' PICK UP 3 JNTS PH6 TAG CIBP AT 5139'
10:30 - 12:30 2.00{CIRC |1 ROLL HOLE CLEAN WITH 190 BBLS, TEST SQUEEZE TO 675 PSI LOST 100 PS|
IN 15 MIN,
12:30 - 13:30 1.00{SEQ |1 RIG DOWN POWER SWIVEL CHANGE ELEVATORS
13:30 - 15:30 200/ TRP |1 POOH 162 JNTS OF PH6 LD PDC BIT
15:30 - 17:30 2.00{TRP |1 MAKE UP 6 1/8" MILL TRIP IN THE HOLE WITH 162 JNTS CLOSE WELL IN FOR
NIGHT CLEAN UP
17:30 - 19:00 1,50 TRAV |1 CREW TRAVEL
10/15/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV 1 10/15/2010 CREW TRAVEL
07:00 - 08:00 1.00{SEQ |1 SAFETY MEETING CHECK SICP 0 SITP 0 RIG UP POWER SWIVEL AND RIG

PUMP
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RWU 23-13B ( 30 ) Spud Date:  10/12/1953
Location: 13-7-S 23-E 26 Rig Release: 11/3/2010
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: #4

Date From.- To | Hours | Code Csoudbe Description of Operations
10/15/2010  |08:00 - 13:30 550|DRL |5 TRIP IN TAG UP AT 5120' CLEAN OUT FILL TAG UP ON CIBP AT 5148' PUMP

DOWN CASING UP TBG GOT PLUGED UP HAD TO REV, PUMP DOWN CASING
UP TBG, START DRILLING OUT CIBP, TRIP IN 21 TAG UP AT 5791 HAS 19' OF
FILL CLEAN OUT TO 5810

13:30 - 15:00 1.50| CIRC 1 ROLL HOLE CLEAN DOWN CASING UP TBG PUMP 200 BBLS CLOSE CASING
IN PUMP DOWN TBG GET INJECTION RATE OF

15:00 - 16:00 1.00| SEQ 1 LAY DOWN POWER SWIVEL

16:00 - 17:30 1.50| TRP 1 POOH WITH 89 JNTS WELL STARTED TO FLOW CLOSE WELL IN EOT AT 3000
CLEAN UP SWIFW

17:30 - 19:00 1.50| TRAV |1 CREW TRAVEL

10/18/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 10/18/2010 CREW TRAVEL
07:00 - 07:30 0.50| RIG 7 SAFETY MEETING CHECK SICP 275 SITF 300 OPEN WELL UP BLEED OFF
07:30 - 08:30 1.00| CIRC 3 RIG UP PUMP TO TBG PUMP 50 BBLS OF BRINE TO KILL WELL DOWN TBG

UP CASING CLOSE WELL IN FOR 10 MIN

08:30 - 09:15 0.75| TRP 1 POOH WITH 56 JNT WELL STARTED FLOWING

09:15 - 15:00 5.75| CIRC 3 PUMP 30 BBLS OF BRINE WATER CLOSE WELL IN FOR 30 MIN SICP 200 SITP
150 SLOWLY BLEED WELL OFF WELL STAYED FLOWING PUMP 80 BBLS OF
BRINE CLOSE WELL IN FOR 1HR

15:00 - 16:00 1.00| TRP 2 TRIP IN THE HOLE WITH 96 JNTS TBG SARTED FLOWING EOT AT 4142’

16:00 - 17:00 1.00|PTST |2 OPEN TBG TO FLOW BACK TANK AND CASING TO FLAT TANK FOR NIGHT,
CLEAN UP SHUT DOWN RIG FOR NIGHT
17:00 - 18:30 1.50{ TRAV |1 CREW TRAVEL
10/19/2010 |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 10/19/2010, CREW TRAVEL
07:00 - 07:30 0.50|RIG 7 SAFETY MEETING CHECK FTP 50 FCP 0
07:30 - 09:30 2.00|CIRC |3 RIG UP PUMP TO CASING PUMP 30 BBLS OF BRINE, PUMP 50 BBLS OF
BRINE DOWN TBG CLOSE WELL IN FOR 1 HR WELL ON VAC
09:30 - 11:00 1.50| TRP 1 POOH WITH 144 JNTS OF PH6 LD BIT SUB AND 6 1/8" MILL
11:00 - 13:00 2.00| TRP 1 MAKE UP 32A PKR TRIP IN WITH 161 JNTS OF PH6 SET PKR AT 5090
13:00 - 14:00 1.00{ CIRC 1 PUMP 10 BBLS GET INJECTION RATE OF 2 BBLS PER MIN AT 400 PSI FILL
CASING WITH 6 BBLS PSI TEST TO 500 LOST 75 IN 5MIN BLEED WELL OFF
CLOSE WELL IN FOR NIGHT CLEAN UP
14:00 - 15:30 1.50| TRAV |1 CREW TRAVEL, NOTE WELL FLOWED BACK 500 BBLS OVER NIGHT
10/20/2010  |06:00 - 07:30 1.50| TRAV |1 10/20/2010, CREW TRAVEL
07:30 - 08:00 0.50| RIG 7 SAFETY MEETING CHECK SICP 0 SITP 0
08:00 - 09:30 1.50| CMT 1 RIG UP HALLIBURTON TO SQUEEZE PERFS AT 5186'-5797' GET INJECTION

RATE OF 2 BBLS PER MIN AT 550 PSI

09:30 - 12:30 3.00| CMT 3 PUMP 175 SACKS, 41.14 BBLS OF TYPE 3 CEMENT AND 27 BBLS
DISPLACEMENT ISIP 1100 CLOSE WELL IN FOR 45 MIN PS| AT 38, PUMP 1
BBL ISIP 786 CLOSE WELL IN FOR 45MIN PS| AT 650 PUMP 0 BBLS PSI UP TO
2000 FOR 15 MIN PSI DOWN TO 1500 BLEED BACK REC 0

12:30 - 13:00 0.50| CIRC 1 RELEASE PKR LD 1 JNT SET PKR AT 5062' REVERSE CIRCULATE 45 BBLS.
PSI TBG UP TO 1800 CLOSE WELL IN FOR NIGHT

13:00 - 14:00 1.00{ CMT 1 RIG DOWN HALLIBURTON CLEAN UP SHUT DOWN
14:00 - 15:30 1.50| TRAV |1 CREW TRAVEL
10/21/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV 1 10/21/2010, CREW TRAVEL
07:00 - 07:30 0.50|RIG 7 SAFETY MEETING CHECK SICP 0 SITP 500
07:30 - 08:00 0.50| EQT 1 RIG UP PUMP TEST CASING TO 1000 PSI FOR 5MIN LOST 0 BLEED PSI OFF

RELEASE PKR

POOH LD 22 JNTS OF PH6 SAND BACK 138 JNTS LD PKR

MAKE UP 6 1/8" MILL TRIP IN WITH 163 JNTS TAG AT 5149’

CHANGE OVER TO 3 1/2 ELEV, RIG UP POWER SWIVEL

START CLEANING OUT CEMENT JNT#1 AT 13:00 DOWN TO 5153' JNT#2 AT
13:10 DOWN TO 5184.5' INT#3 AT 14:30 DOWN TO 5216' JNT#4 AT 15:45

08:00 - 10:30 2.50| TRP
10:30 - 12:00 1.50| TRP
12:00 - 13:00 1.00| SEQ
13:00 - 17:00 4.00| DRL

o = =
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RWU 23-13B ( 30)

Spud Date:  10/12/1953

Location:  13-7-S 23-E 26 Rig Release: 11/3/2010
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: #4
Sub L .
Date From=-To | Hours | Code Code Description of Operations
10/21/2010  [13:00 - 17:00 400(DRL |4 DOWN TO 5247' IJNT#5 AT 17.00 DRILL OUT 5' EOT AT 5253' RIG PUMP BROKE
DOWN
17:00 - 18:00 1.00 | RIG 2 FIX RIG PUMP
18:00 - 19:00 1.00[CIRC |1 ROLL HOLE CLEAN EOT AT 5247' CLOSE WELL IN FOR NIGHT CLEAN UP
19:00 - 20:30 1.50| TRAV |1 CREW TRAVEL 0 BBLS LOST TO DAY
10/22/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 10/22/2010, CREW TRAVEL
07:00 - 07:30 0.50{ RIG 7 SAFETY MEETING CHECK SICP 0 SITP 0
07:30 - 16:30 9.00|DRL |4 MAKE UP INT#5 AT 7:15 TAG UP AT 5252' DRILL OUT TO 5279, INT#6 AT 8:30
DOWN TO 5311 JNT# 7 AT 10:00 DOWN TO 5342' JNT#8 AT 11:40 DOWN TO
5373.5' INT#9 AT 13:00 DOWN TO 5405' JNT#10 AT 14:45 DOWN TO 5436' GET
IT DOWN AT 16:30 VERY HARD CEMENT, DRILL OUT 6 JNTS 184' OF CEMENT
DRILLED OUT TO DAY
16:30 - 17:00 0.50| CIRC |1 ROLL HOLE CLEAN TEST SQUEEZE TO 500 PSI FOR 5 MIN LOST 70 PSI
BLEED OFF
17:00 - 17:30 0.50/TRP |5 PULL 1 JNT LD CLOSE WELL IN FOR WEEKEND CLEAN UP DRAIN PUMP
LINES EOT AT 5405'
17:30 - 19:00 1.50 | TRAV |1 CREW TRAVEL TOTAL BBLS LOST TO DAY 0
10/25/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 10/25/2010 CREW TRAVEL
07:00 -~ 08:00 1.00|RIG 7 SAFETY MEETING CHECK SICP 0 SITP 0 OPEN WELL UP RD POWER SWIVEL
08:00 - 09:30 150/ TRP |1 POOH WITH 171 JNTS OF PH6 LD 6 1/8" MILL
09:30 - 10:00 0.50| WOT |4 WAIT ON PDC BIT 6 1/8" TO GET TO LOCATION
10:00 - 11:30 1.50| TRP |2 MAKE UP 6 1/8" PDC BIT TRIP IN WITH 171 JNTS TAG AT 5436'
11:30 - 12:00 050|SEQ |1 RIG UP POWER SWIVEL AND RIG PUMP DOWN TBG UP CASING
12:00 - 15:00 3.00|DRL |4 START DRILLING OUT CEMENT INT#1 TAG AT 5436-5467' JNT#2 AT 12:30 TAG
AT 5467'-5498' INT#3 AT 13:05 TAG AT 5498'-5530' JNT#4 AT 13:28 TAG AT
5530'-5561.5' INT#5 AT 13:47 TAG AT 5561.5 DRILL OUT 15' OF HARD CEMENT
FALL THROUGH 6' TAG HARD CEMENT DOWN TO 5593' JNT#6 AT 14:05 TAG
AT 5593'-5624.5' INT#7 AT 14:34 TAG AT 5624.5'-5656'
15:00 - 17:00 2.00|CIRC |1 ROLL HOLE FOR 15 MIN TEST SQUEEZE TO 500 PS! LOST 500 PSI IN 2 MIN
ROLL HOLE CLEAN, LD 1 JNT CLOSE WELL IN FOR NIGHT CLEAN UP EOT AT
5624' DRAIN PUMP LINES
17:00 - 19:30 2.50{ TRAV |1 CREW TRAVEL, TOTAL BBLS LOST TO DAY 10
10/26/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50{ TRAV |1 10/26/2010 CREW TRAVEL
07:00 - 07:30 0.50| RIG 7 SAFETY MEETING CHECK SICP 0 SITP 0 TEST SQUEEZE TO 500 PSI LOST
250 IN 5 MIN BLEED OFF
07:30 - 08:00 0.50| RIG 4 CHANGE STRIPPING RUBBER RIG POWER SWIVEL AND 1 JNT
08:00 - 09:45 1.75|DRL |4 TRIP IN JNT#179 TAG UP AT 5656' START DRILLING OUT CEMENT DOWN TBG
UP CASING. JNT#180 AT 8:00 5656'-5688' HARD CEM, JNT#181 AT 8:20 TAG AT
5688'-5717' HARD CEM. JNT#182 AT 8:45 TAG AT 5717"-5748' HARD CEM.
JNT#183 AT 9:09 TAG AT 5748-5779' HARD CEM. JNT#184 AT 9:31 TAG AT
5779'-5810' TAG PBTD
09:45 - 11:30 1.75|CIRC |1 ROLL HOLE CLEAN FOR 20 MIN TEST TO 500 PSI FOR 5 MIN LOST 200 GET
INJECTION RATE OF 1/4 BBL PER MIN ROLE HOLE CLEAN
11:30 - 12:00 0.50| OTH OPEN WELL UP TO FLOW BACK TANK FOR 20 MIN REC 0
12:00 - 12:30 0.50| SEQ |1 RIG DOWN POWER SWIVEL
12:30 - 15:00 2.50|TRP |1 LAY DOWN 10 JNTS POOH WITH 174 JNTS OF PHS6 LD PDC BIT CLEAN UP
DRANE PUMP LINES CLOSE WELL IN FOR NIGHT
15:00 - 16:30 1.50| TRAV |1 CREW TRAVEL, TOTAL BBLS LOST TO DAY 30
10/27/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50{ TRAV |1 10/27/2010, CREW TRAVEL
07:00 - 07:30 0.50| RIG 7 SAFETY MEETING CHECK SICP 20 OPEN WELL UP
07:30 - 10:00 250/ TRP |1 MAKE UP 32A PKR TRIP IN 174 JNTS OF PH6 RIG UP PUMP TEST CASING TO

500 PSIFOR 5 MIN LOST 12 PSI BLEED OFF GET INJECTION RATE OF 1/2 BBL
PER MIN AT 650 PSI '
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RWU 23-13B ( 30) Spud Date:  10/12/1953
Location: 13-7-S 23-E 26 Rig Release: 11/3/2010
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: #4
Date From - To | Hours | Code CSc;Jdbe Description of Operations
10/27/2010  [10:00 - 10:30 0.50(EQT |1 TEST CASIN TO 525 PSI FOR 30 MIN CHECK EVERY 10 MIN #1 PS| AT 513 #2
PSI AT 510 #3 PSI AT 500
10:30 - 11:00 0.50| WOT |1 WAIT ON HALLIBURTION TO GET TO LOCATION
11:00 - 13:00 2.00{CMT |1 SPOT IN HALLIBURTION RIG THEM UP GET READY TO PUMP CEMENT
13:00 - 14:30 1.50|CMT |3 GET INJECTION RATE PUMP OF 1 BBL PER MIN AT 1100 PSI 1/2 BBL PER MIN

AT 550 PSI PUMP 5 BBLS, PUMP 25 SACKS OF TYPE 3 CEMENT DISPLACE 30
BBLS ISIP 1500 PSI

14:30 - 15:30 1.00{ EQT 1 CLOSE WELL IN FOR 1HR RD HALLIBURTION OPEN WELL UP PSI AT 200
BLEED PS! OFF REC 0 BBLS

15:30 - 16:30 1.00{CIRC 1 RELEASE PKR REVERSE CIR 45 BBLS SET PKR AT 5503' PSI UP TO 1500
CLOSE WELL IN CLEAN UP

16:30 - 18:00 1.50| TRAV |1 CREW TRAVEL

10/28/2010 | 05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 10/28/2010, CREW TRAVEL

07:00 - 07:30 0.50|RIG 7 SAFETY MEETING CHECK SICP 0 SITP 300, TEST SQUEEZE TO 1200 PSI FOR

5MIN LOST 0

07:30 - 09:00 1.50| TRP
09:00 - 10:30 1.50| TRP
10:30 - 11:30 1.00) SEQ
11:30 - 13:30 2.00| DRL

RELEASE PKR POOH WITH 174 JNTS OF PH6 LD 32A PKR

MAKE UP 6 1/8" PDC BIT TRIP IN THE HOLE WITH 175 IJNT TAG AT 5545'

RIG UP POWER SWIVEL UP MAKE UP

JINT#176 AT 11:40 TAG AT 55455562 HARD CEM. JNT#177 AT 11:53 TAG AT
5562'-5593' HARD CEM, JNT#178 AT 12:10 5593'-5624.5' HARD CEM, JNT#179
AT 12:25 TAG AT 5624.5' DRILL OUT 10' OF HARD CEM RATTY CEM.DOWN TO
5656'. INT#180 AT 12:40 TAG AT 5656' VERY RATTY CEM, DOWN TO 5688’
JNT#181 AT 13:00 TAG AT 5688' HARD CEM, DOWN TO 5717' JNT#182 AT 5717
FALL THOURGH AT 5723' NO CEM DOWN PBTD 5810'

PN

13:30 - 15:30 2.00| CIRC 1 ROLL HOLE FOR 20 MIN TEST SQUEEZE TO 550 PSI FOR 5 MIN 25 PSI BLEED
OFF ROLL HOLE CLEAN
15:30 - 15:45 0.25|EQT 1 TEST SQUEEZE TO 550 FOR 15 MIN CHECK EVER 5 MIN #1 PSI AT 525 #2 PS|

AT 513 #3 PSI AT 500 BLEED OFF LD 1JNT EOT AT 5780

15:45 - 16:00 0.25|RIG 3 DRAIN PUMP LINES CLEAN UP CLOSE WELL IN FOR NIGHT
16:00 - 17:30 1.50| TRAV |1 CREW TRAVEL
10/29/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV (1 10/29/2010, CREW TRAVEL

07:00 - 07:30 0.50|RIG 7 SAFETY MEETING CHECK SICP 0 SITP 0

07:30 - 08:00 0.50| DRL 5 TRIP IN TAG UP AT 5810' START DRILLING SHOE POWER SWIVEL BROKE
DOWN

08:00 - 14:00 6.00| WOT 4 ROLL HOLE CLEAN FIX POWER SWIVEL,RIG DOWN SWIVEL. RIG UP NEW
SWIVEL

14:00 - 15:30 1.50| DRL 5 TAG UP AT 5810' ON SHOE START DRILLING ON IT AT 13:30 DRILL DOWN TO
5816' VERY TORQUE AND STICKY PULL OVER 15000 PULL UP TO 5810

15:30 - 17:00 1.50| CIRC 1 ROLL HOLE CLEAN

17:00 - 17:30 0.50| SEQ 1 STAND SWIVEL BACK TIE BACK CLOSE WELL IN CLEAN UP DRAIN PUMP
LINES CLOSE WELL IN FOR WEEKEND EOT AT 5780'

17:30 - 19:00 1.50| TRAV |1 CREW TRAVEL TOTAL BBLS LOST TO DAY 35

11/1/2010 05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV (1 11/01/2010, CREW TRAVEL

07:00 - 07:30 0.50|RIG 7 SAFETY MEETING CHECK SICP 100 SITP 100 BLEED WELL OFF

07:30 - 10:00 2.50| DRL 5 TRIP IN 1JNT RIG UP POWER SWIVEL AND 1JNT TAG AT 5814' START
DRILLING OUT SHOE MAKE 2' ROLL HOLE FOR 20 MIN

10:00 - 12:00 2.00| TRP 1 POOH WITH 184 JNTS LD PDC BIT

12:00 - 14:00 2.00| TRP 1 MAKE UP 6 1/8" MILL TRIP IN 184 JNTS RIG UP POWER SWIVEL

14:00 - 17:30 3.50| DRL 5 TAG UP AT 5814' DRILL OUT TO 5841.5' INT#186 AT 16:00 TAG AT 5841.5
DRILL OUT TO 5850' TAG UP ON HARD DRILLING CLEAN OUT TO 5852' PULL
UP TO 5841.5'

17:30 - 19:00 1.50| CIRC 1 ROLL HOLE CLEAN LD 2 JNTS EOT AT 5810' DRAIN PUMP LINES CLEAN UP

SHUT WELL IN FOR NIGHT
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Operations SUmmary Report

Well Name: RWU 23-13B ( 30)

Spud Date:  10/12/1953

Location:  13-7-S 23-E 26 Rig Release: 11/3/2010
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: #4
Sub e .
Date From - To | Hours | Code Code Description of Operations
11/1/2010 | 19:00 - 20:30 1.50| TRAV |1 CREW TRAVEL, 0 BBLS LOST TO DAY
11/2/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV {1 11/2/2010. CREW TRAVEL
07:00 - 07:15 0.25|RIG 7 SAFETY MEETING CHECK SICP 0 SITP 0
07:15 - 12:00 475/DRL |5 TRIP IN 2 JNTS TAG AT 5850' START DRILLING OUT JNT#186 AT 7:30 CLEAN
OUT TO 5863'
12:00 - 15:30 3.50|TRP |3 POOH LD PH6 TBG 187 JNTS
15:30 - 17:00 1.50| PERF |1 RIG UP LONE WOLF MAKE UP 7" CBP TRIP IN SET AT 4000' NO CORALATION
POOH RIG DOWN LONE WOLF
17:00 - 18:30 1.50/BOP |1 NIPPLE DOWN WELL HEAD AND BOPS RACK OUT RIG PUMP CLEAN UP GET
READY TO RIG DOWN SHUT DOWN END DAY
18:30 - 20:00 1.50| TRAV |1 CREW TRAVEL
11/3/2010  |05:30 - 07:00 1.50| TRAV |1 11/3/2010,CREW TRAVEL
07:00 - 08:30 150/ LOC |4 RIG DOWN CLEAN UP LOCATION MOVE RIG TO RW 33-238
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RWU 23-13B ( 30)
13-7-S 23-E 26
Rig Name: AZTEC

Location:

Spud Date:  10/12/1953
Rig Release: 11/17/2010
Rig Number: 777

Date From - To | Hours | Code Csoudbe Description of Operations
11/9/2010  |06:00-06:00 | 24.00{LOC |4 FINISH HAULING RIG AND SETTING INPLACE. RIG UP AND PREPARE TO
DRILL.
REPAIR SPEAR IN DRAWORKS, CHANGE OUT CLUTCH AND ROTOR SEAL.
11/10/2010  |06:00 - 12:00 6.00/LOC |4 PICK UP TOP DRIVE AND FINISH UP GENERAL RIG UP.
12:00 - 17:00 500|BOP |1 NIPPLE UP BOP
17:00 - 21:30 450/BOP |2 PREJOB SAFETY MEETING RIG UP & TEST B.O.P'S TEST PIPE,BLIND,ALL
CHOKE MANIFOLD & KILL VALVES TO 250 LOW & 5000 PSI HIGH TEST
ANNULAR TO 250 LOW & 2500 HIGH & TOP DRIVE VALVE AND FLOOR
VALVES 250 LOW & 5000 PSI HIGH
21:30 - 22:00 0.50(BOP |1 INSTALL WEAR BUSHING
22:00 - 06:00 8.00| TRP |1 PREJOB SAFETY MEETING AND RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE AND PICK UP
B.H.A. AND DRILL PIPE TO GET TO THE COMPOSIT BRIDGE PLUG @ 4014 FT
+0OR-
11/11/2010 | 06:00 - 08:00 200/ TRP |2 PICK UP DRILL PIPE
08:00 - 12:00 4.00/DRL |5 DRILL CBP @ 4015'
12:00 - 13:30 1.50| TRP |2 PICK UP DRILL PIPE
13:30 - 14:00 0.50| OTH RIG DOWN LAY DOWN TRUCK
14:00-02:30 | 12.50|DRL |4 DRILL CEMENT AND FLOAT EQUIPMENT F/5860 T/ 5877
02:30 - 05:00 2.50| TRP |10 PUMP TRIP SLUG BLOW DOWN TOP DRIVE & TRIP FOR MOTOR & BIT #1
05:00 - 06:00 1.00| TRP |1 HANDLE BHA
11/12/2010  |06:00 - 09:00 3.00| TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE WITH BIT #1
09:00 - 09:30 0.50[DRL |1 DRILLING F/5877 T/5885
09:30 - 10:00 0.50|EQT |2 FIT TEST TO 375 PSI (9.6 EMW)
10:00 - 14:30 450|DRL |1 DRILLING F/5885 T/6424 539' 119.7HR
WOB 10/12 RPM 115 GPM 260
14:30 - 15:30 1.00{SUR 1 SURVEY @ 6360' 1.8 DEG 33.5AZ
15:30 - 19:30 4.00{DRL {1 DRILLING F/6424 T/ 8932
19:30 - 20:30 1.00| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE ( TOP DRIVE)
20:30 - 21:30 1.00| RIG 2 RIG REPAIRE( ACUATOR ON MUD SAVER VALVE)
21:30-01:30 400{DRL |1 DRILL FROM 6932 TO 7254 FEET 322" 80.5HR
(WOB= 10/12K RPM=115,GPM=260
01:30 - 02:30 1.00|SUR |1 WIRE LINE SURVEY @ 7146 FEET 3.3 DEG AZMOTH=82.7
02:30 - 06:00 3.50| DRL |1 DRILL FROM 7254 FEET TO 7700 FEET 446' 127/HR
WOB 10/12 RPM 120 GPM 260
11/13/2010  |06:00 - 14:00 8.00{DRL |1 DRILLING F/7700 T/8339 639" 79.97HR
WOB 12/14 RPM 120 GPM 260
14:00 - 14:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVIGE
14:30-06:00 | 15.50{DRL |1 DRILLING F/8339 T/9600 1261' 81.3/HR
WOB 12/15 RPM 120 GPM 260
11/14/2010  |06:00 - 14:00 8.00/DRL |1 DRILLING F/9600 T/10234 634' 79.25
WOB 12/15 RPM 120 GPM 260
14:00 - 15:00 1.00| RIG 1 RIG AND TOP DRIVE SERVICE
15:00 -06:00 | 15.00{DRL |1 DRILLING F/10234 T/ 10880 646 FEET FOR 43.06 FPR
WOB 12/15 RPM 120 GPM 260
11/15/2010  |06:00 - 08:00 2.00{CIRC {1 CIRCULTE AND CONDITION HOLE FOR SHORT TRIP
08:00 - 13:00 5.00|TRP |15 TRIP TO CASING SHOE, TIGHT HOLE @ 10392,10252,8572,8290,7088, AND
SHOE
13:00 - 14:30 1.50 | RIG 6 FLOW CHECK WELL AND CUT DRILLING LINE
14:30 - 18:00 3.50|TRP |15 TRIP IN HOLE
18:00 - 18:30 0.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM 75 FEET TO BOTTOM WITH 40 FEET OF FILL
18:30 - 22:00 3.50|CIRC |1 CIRC & COND. HOLE FOR LOGS & CASING
22:00 - 03:30 550[ TRP |2 DROP SURVEY, PUMP TRIP SLUG,& DROP DRILL PIPE DRIFT TRIP OUT FOR

DEPLOYMENT LOGGING TOOLS S.L.M. BOARD= 10850 STRAP = 10888 (NO
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RWU 23-13B (30)

Spud Date:  10/12/1953

Location: 13-7-S 23-E 26 Rig Release: 11/17/2010
Rig Name: AZTEC Rig Number: 777
Date From - To | Hours | Code ng'dbe Description of Operations
11/15/2010  |22:00 - 03:30 550, TRP |2 CORRECTION)
03:30 - 06:00 2.50| TRP 1 LAY DOWN B.HA.
11/16/2010  |06:00 - 08:00 2.00/LOG |1 PICK UP WEATHERFORD SHUTTLE DEPOYED LOGGING TOOLS, AND 5 JTS E
DRILL PIPE
08:00 - 15:30 7.50| TRP |2 PICK UP 35 JTS OF G DRILL PIPE AND T.1.H. WITH QUAD COMBO SHUTTLE
LOGS
15:30 - 16:00 0.50| WCL |1 WASH 60' TO BOTTOM, NO FILL
16:00 - 17:00 1.00|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE BUTTOMS UP
17:00 - 17:30 0.50|CIRC |1 DROP DART & DEPLOY SHUTTLE LOGGING TOOLS (QUAD COMBO)
17:30 - 22:00 450|LOG |1 LOG WELL WITH QUAD COMBO LOGGING TOOLS ON DRILL PIPEFROM 10848
TO 5871 FEET ‘
22:00 - 00:30 250|TRP |2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE
00:30 - 02:00 1.50/LOG |1 LAY DOWN LOGS & 5 JOINTS OF "E" PIPE PROCESS LOGS (0.K.)
02:00 - 02:30 0.50{ OTH PULL WEAR BUSHING
02:30 - 03:30 1.00|/CSG |1 PREJOB SAFETY MEETING CHANGE OUT BAILS & RIG UP LAY DOWN
MACHINE AND CASING CREWS
03:30 - 06:00 250{CSG |1 RUN 4 1/2",13.5#, N-80, LT&C CASING
11/17/2010  |06:00 - 10:30 450/CSG |2 RUN 4 1/2",13.5#, N-80, LT&C CASING
10:30 - 15:00 450/CSG |2 WASH CASING IN HOLE F/9290 T/9845
15:00 - 16:00 1.00/CSG |2 RUN 4 1/2",13.5#, N-80, LT&C CASING
CASONG LANDED @ 10874'
16:00 - 19:30 3.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULTE AND CONDTION HOLE FOR CEMENT
19:30 - 22:30 3.00|CMT |2 PRE JOB SAFETY MEETING /RIG UP HALCO & CEMENT 4 1/2" CASING. BUMP
PLUG & CHECK FLOATS (FLOATS HELD)NO CEMENT BACK SURFACE. 22
BBLS OF FLUSH BACK. ESTAMATED TOP OF CEMENT 1120'
22:30 - 23:00 0.50{CMT |1 RIG DOWN HALCO AND LOAD OUT
23:00 - 01:30 2.50/BOP |1 NIPPLE DOWN B.O.P'S AND SET SLIPS @ 140,000
01:30 - 06:00 450|TRP |3 RIG UP AND LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE IN THE MOUSE HOLE
11/18/2010  |06:00 - 10:00 400, TRP |3 LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE IN MOUSE HOLE
10:00 - 12:00 200[LOC |7 CLEAN MUD TANKS
RIG RELEASED @ 12:00 11/17/2010
12:00 - 06:00 18.00|LOC |4 RIG DOWN

Printed: 3/15/2011 1:45:04 PM




Cornpletian Sumpoany

QEP ENERGY Page 1 of 2

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RWU 23-13B ( 30)
13-7-S 23-E 26
Rig Name: RIGLESS

Location:

Spud Date:  10/12/1953
Rig Release:
Rig Number: N/A

Date

From - To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

2/3/2011

21472011

06:00 - 14:00

06:00 - 14:00

8.00

8.00

STIM

STIM

TIGHT HOLE - Perforate and Frac Mesa Verde Intervals.

NOTE: All perforating done using a 3-1/8" csg gun @ 3 JPF & 120* phasing. All
fracing is done using a 2% KCL slick water system. All plugs set are Halliburton
Obsidian composite frac plugs.

On 1/18/11 - RU Lone Wolf WL & ran a gauge ring to tag @ 10775'. Rana
CBL/VDL/GR log from tag @ 10774' to surface w/ TOC est @ 1570". Correlated the
log to the Weatherford Comp Density/Neutron log dated 11/16/10. On 1/28/11 -
Pressure tested the csg & frac head assembly to 7000# & held OK. Perforated w/
Lone Wolf WL Mesa Verde intervals as follows using the above gun per the CBL log
dated 1/18/11 - 10476-82"; 10490-96' & 10504-08' (48 holes). No pressure prior to
or after perforating with the hole full of 2% KCL water. S| until frac.

On 2/2/11 - Zone #1 - MV (10476-10508"); Frac this interval w/ 2% slick water
system as follows: Pump 800 gals of 15% HCL followed by a 37,000 gal pad &
stage 0.25 to 1.25 ppg 30/50 sand in 100,000 gals of fluid w/ no spacers & flush w/
7000 gals of water. Total of 120,000# of sand & a total load of 3700 bbls. Max rate
= 50.9 BPM; avg rate = 50.3 BPM, Max psi = 5757#; avg psi = 4060#. [SIP = 2724#
(0.70). Lubricate in a comp frac plug & set @ 10430'. Perforate per the above gun
& log MV interval 10272-84' (36 holes).

Zone #2 MV (10272-84"): Frac this interval w/ a 2% KCL slick water system as
follows: Breakdown w/ 400 gals of 15% HCL & frac w/ a 10,000 gal pad & stage
0.25 to 1.25 ppg 30/50 sand in 47,000 gals of fluid & aborted frac due to high
pressure & decreasing rate & flush w/ 8000 gals of fluid w/ this volume including a
spacer to see if pressure would decline allowing the rate to increase. It did not.
Pumped a total of 21,200# of 30/50 sand & a total load of 1375 bbls. Max rate =
48.9#, avg rate = 34.4 BPM; max psi = 6175#; avg psi = 6025#, ISIP = 3684#
(.0.80).

Wireline set a comp frac plug @ 10150'. Perforate MV interval 10082-96' per the
above gun & log.

Zone #3 MV (10082-96'"): Frac this interval w/ a 2% KCL slick water system as
follows: Breakdown w/ 800 gals of 15% HCl acid & frac w/ a 10,000 gal pad & stage
0.25 to 1.25 ppg 30/50 sand in 50,000 gals of fluid w/ no spacers & flush w/ 6780
gals of water. Total of 47,800# of sand & a total of 1580 bbls. Max rate = 55 BPM;
avg rate = 52 BPM; max psi = 5074#, avg psi = 4757#, ISIP = 2906# (0.72). Sl the
well for 2 hours & RDMO Halliburton.

After thawing out the flowback lines SICP = 1600# @ 11:30 PM. Open the well on a
14/64" choke & flow the well on a 14/64" choke for the next 6 hours @ 100 BPH. At
6:00 AM on 2/3/11 FCP = 1675# on a 14/64" choke & have recovered 600 bbls of
water in the last 6 hours w/ no gas or sand. Continue to flow back the well.

Csg Size: 4-1/2", 13.5#, L-80
Csg Depth: 10874’

LLTR: 6215 BBLS

PERFS

Zone 1-MV

10476-82'; 10490-96'; 10504-08'

Zone #2 - MV

10272-84'

Zone #3 - MV

10082-96";

TIGHT HOLE - At 4:30 PM on 2/3/11 FCP = 500# on a 14/64" choke with a show of
gas at a flow rate of 60 BPH to the flow back tank w/ no sand & a total recovery of

Printed: 3/15/2011 1:45:46 PM



QEP ENERGY Page 2 of 2

Operations Summary Report

Location:

Well Name: RWU 23-13B (30)

13-7-S 23-E 26

Rig Name: RIGLESS

Spud Date:  10/12/1953
Rig Release:
Rig Number: N/A

Date

From - To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

2/4/2011

06:00 - 14:00

8.00

STIM

1480 bbls of water in the 17 hours. Turn well over to production.
Comp. Frac Plugs @ 10430' & 10150".

Csg Size: 4-1/2", 13.5#, L-80
Csg Depth: 10874’

LLTR: 5935 BBLS

PERFS

Zone 1 - MV

10476-82'; 10490-96'; 10504-08'
Zone #2 - MV

10272-84'

Zone #3 - MV

10082-96";

Printed: 3/15/2011 1:45:46 PM




Sundry Number: 14542 APl Wl | Number: 43047151570000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ey :
. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS e OTTEEO
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current -
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
DRILL form for such proposals. RED WASH
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well RW 23-13B
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047151570000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext RED WASH
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH
1882 FSL 1920 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 13 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
VI NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [0 cHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [0 cHanGE TUBING [0 cHANGE WELL NAME
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
[ sueseQUENT REPORT (] peepen [] FRACTURE TREAT [] NEw consTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
[] DRILLING REPORT [] wATER SHUTOFF [] sITa STATUS EXTENSION [] app ExTENSION
Report Date:
v WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION ] otHer OTHER: | Wildcat Tax Credit Appl

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
QEP Energy Company requests that the wildcat tax credit be applied to the
above well. This is the first well with production from the Mesaverde pool
within a one mile radius at the time of completion (see attached map). The Approved by the
Mesaverde Formation is at 8196' in the subject wellbore, significantly deeper ~ Utah Division of
than the previously tested wells in the area. Gas production in this part of the Qil, Gas and Mining
basin has particularly been from shallower horizons and therefore, this well o 06}/16/291\1

should be considered wildcat in nature. Offset wells include: SEE ATTACHERate:{ » ~ .
By awwe

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Valyn Davis 435 781-4369 Regulatory Affairs Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 4/25/2011

RECEIVED Apr. 25, 2011




Sundry Number: 14542 APl Wl | Number: 43047151570000

UTAH

DNR

.-A*....f

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

OIL, GAS B MINING

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43047151570000

See attached Statement of Basis.

RECEIVED Apr. 25, 2011




Sundry Number: 14542 APl Wl | Number: 43047151570000

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
Wildcat Well Determination
STATEMENT OF BASIS

Applicant: _QEP Energy Company

Location: NWSE Sec 13 T070S R230E Uintah county, Utah

WELL NAME: RW 23-13B APl #: 43-047-15157

FINDINGS

1.

e

This well was originally completed on November 15, 1953 in the Green River
formation, with a spud date of October 12, 1953 reaching a total depth of 5,850 feet.

. Several wells in the surrounding 1-mile radius have produced out of the Green River

formation.

A permit to deepen was approved on August 31, 2010.

Well was deepened and re-completed on February 2, 2011 in the Mesa Verde
formation, with a spud date of November 11, 2010 reaching a total depth of 10,797
feet TVD.

This well was > 1 mile from any known production in the Mesa Verde Formation at
the time of the re-completion. (Attachment A)

The RW 44-14B well, also operated by QEP, is 2639’ from subject well and was
completed on February 3, 2011 is also producing out of the Mesa Verde formation.
(Attachment A)

There has been no production out of the Mesa Verde formation from other wells
within a 1-mile radius of this well. (See Attachment A for surrounding well
information)

CONCLUSIONS

Based on the findings above the Division has determined the RW 23-13B was
drilled into an unknown area for the Mesa Verde formation, which applied before
the RW 44-14B well. The Division finds that this well qualifies for the severance tax
exemption under Section 59-5-102(5)(b) for wildcat wells. This determination was
made in accordance with Oil and Gas General Conservation Rule R649-3-35. If the
operator disagrees with this determination, the decision may be appealed to the
Board of Oil Gas and Mining.

Reviewer(s): Dustin K. Doucet v Date: &/ [C]29(]

Joshua J. Payne Date: May 16, 2011

RECEIVED Apr. 25, 2011
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Sundry Number: 14542 APl Wl | Number: 43047151570000
11 2 s
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Sundry Nunber: 45837 APl Well Nunber: 43047151570000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING U-081 '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below

current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION | 7-UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. RED WASH
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well RW 23-13B
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047151570000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext RED WASH
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH
1882 FSL 1920 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 13 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
] NOTICE OF INTENT [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
/ SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME J RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D D |:|
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER: I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
INTERIM RECLAIMED IN FALL 2011. PLEASE SEE ATTACHED BLM Accepted by the
APPROVED SUNDRY. FOR DOGM RECORD ONLY. Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining
FOR RECORD ONLY
January 09, 2014

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Amanda Taylor 435 247-1023 Reclamation Technician
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 12/12/2013

RECEI VED: Dec. 12, 2013




Sundry Nunber: 45837 APl Well Nunber: 43047151570000

Form 3160-5
(August 2007) UNITED STATES OME NO, 10040135
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires: July 31 2010
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT —XPITES Y 52,
5. Lease Seria No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS uTu081
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an S T india Alion e N
abandoned well. Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. - [TIndian, Allottee or Tribe Name
. ; ; ; 7. 1f Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side. 8920007610
1. Typeof Well 8. Well Name and No.
R Oil Well [J GasWell [J Other RW 23-138
2. Name of Operator Contact:  AMANDA TAYLOR 9. APl Well No.

QEP ENERGY COMPANY

E-Mail: amanda.taylor@qgepres.com

43-047-15157-00-S1

3a. Address
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH

3b. Phone No. (include area code)
Ph: 435-247-1023

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
RED WASH

VERNAL, UT 84078

4. Location of Well  (Footage, Sec., T., R.,, M., or Survey Description)
Sec 13 T7S R23E NESW 1889FSL 1924FWL

11. County or Parish, and State
UINTAH COUNTY, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
O Notice of Intent O Acidize O Deepen O Production (Start/Resume) 0O Water Shut-Off
O Alter Casing O Fracture Treat ® Reclamation 0O Wdll Integrity
® Subsequent Report O Casing Repair O New Construction O Recomplete O Other
O Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon
O Convert to Injection 0O Plug Back O Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state al pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal isto deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in anew interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the siteisready for fina inspection.)

RW 23-13B WAS DOWNSIZED AND INTERIM RECLAIMED IN THE FALL OF 2011. RECLAMATION OPERATIONS FOLLOWED
THE QEP ENERGY COMPANY, UINTA BASIN DIVISION, RECLAMATION PLAN, SEPTEMBER 2009 AND THE BLM GREEN
RIVER DISTRICT RECLAMATION GUIDELINES. RECLAMATION SPECIFIC TO THIS LOCATION INCLUDE:

1. ALL NON-ESSENTIAL EQUIPMENT AND DEBRIS WERE REMOVED.

2. AREAS NOT NEEDED FOR PRODUCTION OPERATIONS WERE RIPPED TO RELIEVE COMPACTION AND RECONTOURED TO
BLEND WITH THE SURROUNDING LANDSCAPE. TOPSOIL WAS SPREAD TO THE APPROPRIATE DEPTH.

3. THE LOCATION WAS DISCED AND SEEDED WITH THE APPROVED SEED MIX. CERTIFIED WEED FREE STRAW WAS
CRIMPED IN AT A RATE OF 1.5 TONS PER ACRE.

THE TOTAL DISTURBED AREA WAS 1.23 ACRES
THE RECLAIMED AREA IS 0.48 ACRES

Electronic Submission #199804 verified by the BLM Well Information System
For QEP ENERGY COMRANY, sent to the Vernal
Committed to AFMSS for processing by BOBBI SCHROEDER on 03/19/2013 (13BJS0351SE)

Name(Printed/Typed) AMANDA TAYLOR Titte RECLAMATION TECHNICIAN

14. | hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct. %

Signature (Electronic Submission) Date  02/25/2013

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

ACCEPTED
TitteACCEPTED

Date 09/03/2013

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Office Vernal

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

**BLM REVISED ** BLM REVISED ** BLM REVISED ** BLM REVISED ** BLM REVISED **

RECEI VED: Dec. 12, 2013



Sundry Nunber: 45837 APl Well Nunber: 43047151570000

Additional data for EC transaction #199804 that would not fit on the form

32. Additional remarks, continued
THE ACTIVE AREA IS 0.75 ACRES
THE LOCATION WILL BE MONITORED PER QEP'S RECLAMATION PLAN.

RECEI VED: Dec. 12, 2013



Sundry Nunber: 45837 APl Well Nunber:

43047151570000

Revisions to Operator-Submitted EC Data for Sundry Notice #199804

Sundry Type:

Lease:

Agreement:

Operator:

Admin Contact:

Tech Contact:

Location:
State:
County:

Field/Pool:

Well/Facility:

Operator Submitted

RECL
SR

uTu081
RED WASH

QEP ENERGY COMPANY
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH
VERNAL, UT 84078

Ph: 435-247-1023

AMANDA TAYLOR
RECLAMATION TECHNICIAN
E-Mail: AMANDA.TAYLOR@QEPRES.COM

Ph: 435-247-1023

AMANDA TAYLOR

RECLAMATION TECHNICIAN

E-Mail: AMANDA.TAYLOR@QEPRES.COM

Ph: 435-247-1023

uT
UINTAH

RED WASH
RW 23-13B

Sec 13 T7S R23E NESW 1889FSL 1924FWL
40.207430 N Lat, 109.277880 W Lon

BLM Revised (AFMSS)

RECL
SR

UTu081
8920007610 (UTU630100)

QEP ENERGY COMPANY
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH
VERNAL, UT 84078

Ph: 435-781-4032

Fx: 435-781-4045

AMANDA TAYLOR

RECLAMATION TECHNICIAN
E-Mail: amanda.taylor@gepres.com
Ph: 435-247-1023

AMANDA TAYLOR

RECLAMATION TECHNICIAN
E-Mail: amanda.taylor@gepres.com

Ph: 435-247-1023

uT
UINTAH

RED WASH

RW 23-13B
Sec 13 T7S R23E NESW 1889FSL 1924FWL

RECEI VED: Dec.

12, 2013



Sundry Nunber: 67177 APl Well Nunber: 43047151570000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING -081
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below

current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. RED WASH
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well RW 23-13B
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047151570000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 595-5919 Ext RED WASH
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH
1882 FSL 1920 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 13 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
] acioize L] acTer casing [ casine repar
¥ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [ chanee To PReVios PLANS O chance Tusine O chanee weLt nave
] chance weLL staTus L] comMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [J convertweLL Tvee
[] susseqQueNT RePORT L] oeeren (] rraCTURE TREAT [J new consTrucTION
Date of Work Completion:
O] operaTor crance CJ pLuc anp ABanDON O ruseack
[ rrobuCTION START OR RESUME (] RecLamaTION OF weLL SITE [J RecompLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
[ spuo reporT
Date of Spud: ¥ REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION (] sipETRACK TO REPAIR WELL [J remporary ABANDON
O tusine Repar O vent orFLare 0 warer pisposaL
[ oriLLinG RepoRT (] warer sHutore L] si7a sTaTus ExTENSION [J aro exrension
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER: | I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP Energy Company requests approval to recomplete the RW 23-13B Accepted by the
by adding perforations to the Mesaverde formation. See attached _Utah Divisior} qf
procedures. Qil, Gas and Mining
Date:

By: \ ‘L »\7{'

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE
Jan Nelson 435 781-4331 Permit Agent
SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 10/21/2015

RECEI VED: Cct. 21, 2015




QEP Energy requests approval to recomplete the RW 23-13B by adding perforations to the
Mesaverde formation as follows:

1. Set CFP at 10,062°.
2. Stage 1

a. 10,042°-10,044°, 3spf, frac with slick water
10,024°-10,026°, 3spf, frac with slick water
9,960°-9,962", 3spf, frac with slick water
9,948°-9,950°, 3spf, frac with slick water
9,926°-9,928’, 3spf, frac with slick water
9,919°-9,921°, 3spf, frac with slick water
0,822°-9,824°, 3spf, frac with slick water

h. 9,809°-9.811°, 3spf, frac with slick water
3. Set CFP at 9,762°.
4. Stage 2

a. 9,740°-9,742’, 3spf, frac with slick water
9,724’-9,726’, 3spf, frac with slick water
9,706°-9,708°, 3spf, frac with slick water
9,668°-9,670°, 3spf, frac with slick water
9,641°-9,643°, 3spf, frac with slick water
9,623°-9,625°, 3spf, frac with slick water
9,588°-9,590°, 3spf, frac with slick water

h. 9,570°-9572°, 3spf, frac with slick water
5. Set CEFP at 9,545°.
6. Stage3

a. 9,522°-9,525°, 3spf, frac with slick water
9,505°-9,507°, 3spf, frac with slick water
9,436°-9,440°, 3spf, frac with slick water
9,403°-9,405°, 3spf, frac with slick water
9,394°-9,396°, 3spf, frac with slick water
9,350°-9,351°, 3spf, frac with slick water

g. 9,320°-9,322°, 3spf, frac with slick water
7. Drill up top two plugs and return well to production.
8. Return to drill up the bottom plug and restore existing production after the frac fluid is

recovered.

@ moe oo o N N

I



Sundry Nunber: 68470 APl Well Nunber: 43047151570000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

uU-081

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
RED WASH

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
RW 23-13B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43047151570000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078

PHONE NUMBER:
303 595-5919 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
RED WASH

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:

1882 FSL 1920 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 13 Township: 07.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
UINTAH

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

l:‘ ACIDIZE

l:‘ CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS

l:‘ ALTER CASING

l:‘ NOTICE OF INTENT

- . I:‘ CHANGE TUBING
Approximate date work will start:

l:‘ CHANGE WELL STATUS l:‘ COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS

J SUBSEQUENT REPORT

Date of Work Completion: l:‘ DEEPEN l:‘ FRACTURE TREAT

l:‘ OPERATOR CHANGE l:‘ PLUG AND ABANDON

1 spub rerorT [ propucTion START OR RESUME L recLamaTiON OF WELL SITE

Date of Spud:

J REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION l:‘ SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
l:‘ TUBING REPAIR l:‘ VENT OR FLARE

l:‘ DRILLING REPORT

Report Date: l:‘ SI TA STATUS EXTENSION

l:‘ OTHER

l:‘ WATER SHUTOFF

l:‘ WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION

|:| CASING REPAIR

D CHANGE WELL NAME

(]
(]
O
(]
(]

D WATER DISPOSAL

CONVERT WELL TYPE

NEW CONSTRUCTION

PLUG BACK

RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

TEMPORARY ABANDON

|:| APD EXTENSION

OTHER: I |

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
QEP Energy Company re-perforated the RW 23-13B Mesaverde formation. A short summary of the
additional perforations is as follows: Stage 1 - 9320'-9525' (48 shots), Stage 2 - 9570'-9742' (48
shots), Stage 3 - 9806'-10,044' (48 shots). The frac used 18,048 bbls slickwater and 490,380 Ibs.

proppant sand. The well was returned to production on 11/25/2015. Please see the attached

perforation summary and daily report.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Valyn Davis 435 781-4369 Regulatory Affairs Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 12/22/2015

RECEI VED: Dec.

22, 2015




43047151570000

Vel | Nunber:

68470 API

Sundry Nunber :

RW 23-13B

AFE - DRL-CT (Completion), 2/2/2011 06:00

Well Name Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Objective Start Date Job End Date
RW 23-13B AFE - DRL-CT (Completion) DEVELOPMENT AFE 21212011 3/21/2011
AFE - REC (Recomplete), 11/11/2015 06:00
Well Name Primary Job Type Secondary Job Type Objective Start Date Job End Date
RW 23-13B AFE - REC {Recomplete) Recomplete 11/11/2015 11/26/2015
Cum Time
Log Time Log Hrs
RPT # End Date (days) Current Ops Summary 5 (hr) Created By
115/1/2004 06:00 0.42 |TUBING 10.00 [DFW_WV310User
2 |5/4/2004 06:00 0.83 | 5/3/04 PUMP CHANGE & LAY DOWN 10.00 |DFW_WV310User
SMA: FINAL REPORT
1110/5/2010 06:00 0.31[10/5/2010 ROAD RIG FROM YARD TO 10/5/2010 ROAD RIG FROM YARD TO LOCATION 45 MILES SPOT IN RIG 7.50 | DFW_WV310User
LOCATION 45 MILES SPOTINRIGUP  [UP RUN PUMP LINES TO WELL HEAD CHECK SITP 50 SICP 800 BLEED
RUN PUMP LINES TO WELL HEAD TBG OFF UNSEAT ROD PUMP LD ROD SUB & 2- 3/4™ SLICK RODS PICK
CHECK S UP P,R, CLOSE WELL IN FOR NIGHT TRAVEL
2110/6/2010 06:00 0.85 | 10/6/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP, RU 10/6/2010,TRAVEL CHECK SIP, RU HOT OILER FLUSH TBG 35BBLS PICK 13.00 | DFW_WWV310User
HOT OILER FLUSH TBG 35BBLS PICK |UP 2-3/4"™ SLICK RODS SEAT ROD PUMP FILL WITH 30BBLS TEST TO
UP 2-3/4™ SLICK RODS SEAT ROD 1000 PSI GOOD TEST, POQOH LD RODS 202 & 1-6'x1"" SUB AND ROD
PUMP F PUMP CHANGE OVER TO TBG EQUIPMENT
310/7/2010 06:00 1.42110/7/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP ND 10/7/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP ND WELL HEAD NU BOPS RELEASE TAC 13.50 | DFW_WV310User
WELL HEAD NU BOPS RELEASE TAC RIG UP FLOOR & TBG TONGS POOH TALLY CUT LD TAC & SN, MAKE UP
RIG UP FLOOR & TBG TONGS POOH 61/8" BIT& 7" SCRAPER AND BALL TEST SUB TRIP IN THE HOLE WITH
TALLY OUT 175 TAG CIBP @ 5146' LD 1 JNT RIG UP PUMP ROLL HOLE CLEAN 197
BBLS
4110/8/2010 06:00 1.2 |10/8/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP POOH  [10/8/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP POOH WITH 174 JNTS LD BHA, MAKE UP 12.00 | DFW_WV310User
WITH 174 JNTS LD BHA, MAKE UP 32A |32A PKR TRIP IN WITH 149 JNTS SET PKR AT 4395' FILL & TEST TO 1500
PKR TRIP IN WITH 149 JNTS SET PKR  |PSIFOR 5 MIN LOST 0 RELEASE PKR TRIP IN 16 JNTS SET PKR AT 4862’
GET INJECTION RATE DOWN TBG 2 1/4 BBL PER MIN AT 600 PSI
5110/11/2010 06:00 2.40|10/11/2010,TRAVEL CHECK SIP RIG 10/11/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP RIG UP HALLIBURTON, SQUEEZE PERFS 11.50 | DFW_WV310User
UP HALLIBURTON, SQUEEZE PERFS AT 4929-5020' WITH 125 SACKS OF 3 NEAT CEM, 28 BBLS DISPLACE
AT 4929'-5020' WITH 125 SACKS OF 3 ISIP 2050 WACH FOR 1/2 HR PSI AT 1200 PUMP 1/2 BBL ISIP 2500 WACH
NEA 15MIN PSI AT 1600 BLEED OFF REC 0BBLS RELEASE PKR PULL 11 JNTS
6110/12/2010 06:00 2.92110/12/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP TEST 10/12/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP TEST SQUEEZE TO 1500 FOR 5MIN LOST 12.50 [ DFW_WV310User
SQUEEZE TO 1500 FOR 5MIN LOST 600 PSI TEST CASING ABOVE PKR TO 1500 FOR 5MIN LOST 0 BLEED
600 PSI TEST CASING ABOVE PKR OFF POOH LD 2 7/8"™ TBG 172 TOTAL, CHANGE OVER TO MYT ELE,
TO 150 TALLY PH6 MAKE UP 6 1/8" BIT AND BIT SUB PICK UP 82 JNTS EOT AT
2600'
7(10/13/2010 06:00 3.48|10/13/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP RU 10/13/2010,TRAVEL CHECK SIP RU PUMP ROLL HOLE WITH 13.50 |DFW_WV310User
PUMP ROLL HOLE WITH 40BBLS, TEST [40BBLS, TEST CASING TO 1000 PSI LOST 80 PSI, TALLY PICK PH6 64
CASING TO 1000 PSI LOST 80 PsSl, JNTS TAG AT 4552' RIG UP POWER SWIVEL GET CIRC WITH 2 BBLS
TALLY START DRILLING OQUT CEMENT DOWN TQ 4773' ROLL HOLE CLEAN
TEST SQUEEZE 500 LOST 25PSI
8110/14/2010 06:00 4.04 [10/14/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP PICK 10/14/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP PICK UP 3 JNTS TAG UP AT 4869' START 13.50 [ DFW_WV310User
UP 3 JNTS TAG UP AT 4869' START DRILLING OUT CEMENT DOWN TO 5148' ROLL HOLE CLEAN TEST
DRILLING QUT CEMENT DOWN TO CASING TO 1000 PSI FOR 5MIN LOST 75PSI| DRILL QUT CEMENT DOWN
5148'R TO 5030' TRIP IN TAG CIBP @ 5139' ROLL HOLE TEST TO 675 FOR 15MIN
LOST 100




43047151570000

Vel | Nunber:

68470 API

Sundry Nunber :

RW 23-13B

Cum Time
Log Time Log Hrs
RPT # End Date (days) Current Ops Summary (hr) Created By
9(10/15/2010 06:00 4.60|10/15/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP RU 10/15/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP RU POWER SWIVEL TRIP IN TAG AT 13.50 [DFW_WWV310User
POWER SWIVEL TRIP IN TAG AT 5120' |5120' CLEAN OUT TO 5148' TAG CIBP DRILL IT OUT TRIP IN TAG FILL
| CLEAN QUT TO 5148' TAG CIBP DRILL |5791' CLEAN OUT TO 5810' ROLL HOLE CLEAN 200BBLS RD POWER
SWIVEL POOH WELL FLOWING POOH WITH 89 JNTS EOT AT 3000
CWIFW
10(10/18/2010 06:00 5.15 [10/18/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP PUMP  |10/18/2010,TRAVEL CHECK SIP PUMP 50 BBLS OF BRINE WATER POCH 13.00 | DFW_WV310User
50 BBLS OF BRINE WATER POCH 56 56 JNTS TBG AND CASING STARTED FLOWING PUMP 30BBLS BRINE
JNTS TBG AND CASING STARTED WATER CLOSE WELL IN FOR 1/2HR WELL STAYED FLOWING,CLOSE
FLOWING WELL IN FOR 1 HR PUMP 80BBLS OF BRINE,TRIP IN 96 JNTS CPEN
WELL TO FLOW BACK TANK
11(10/19/2010 06:00 556 |10/19/2010, TRAVEL CHECK FLOWING |10/19/2010,TRAVEL CHECK FLOWING PSI RIG UP PUMP, PUMP 30BELS 10.00 | DFW_WV310User
PSI RIG UP PUMP, PUMP 30BBLS DOWN CASING, 50BBLS DOWN CLOSE WELL IN FOR 1HR WELL ON
DOWN CASING, 50BBLS DOWN VAC POOH WITH 144 JNTS LD BIT SUB AND MILL, MAKE UP 32A PKR
CLOSE WELL IN TRIP IN WITH 161 SET PKR AT 5090' GET INJECTION RATE OF 2BBLS
PER MIN @ 400PSI
12 110/20/2010 06:00 5.96 |110/20/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP RIG 10/20/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP RIG UP HALLIBURTON SQUEEZE PERFS 9.50 | DFW_WV310User
UP HALLIBURTON SQUEEZE PERFS AT 5186'-5797' WITH 41.14 BBLS OF CEMENT TYPE3, 27BBLS
AT 5186'-5797' WITH 41.14 BBLS OF DISPLACEMENT ISIP 1100 CLOSE WELL IN FOR 45MIN PSI AT 38 PUMP
CEMEN 1BBL PSI UP 786 CLOSE WELL IN FOR 45MIN PSI 650 PUMP OBBLS PSI
UP 2000
13[10/21/2010 06:00 6.58 | 10/21/2010. TRAVEL CHECK SIP TEST | 10/21/2010.TRAVEL CHECK SIP TEST SQUEEZE TO 1000 FOR 5MIN LOST 15.00 | DFW_WWV310User
SQUEEZE TO 1000 FOR 5MIN LOST Q0 |0 RELEASE PKR POOH WITH 160JNTS LD PKR MAKE UP & 1/8™ MILL
RELEASE PKR POOH WITH 160JNTS TRIP IN WITH 163JNTS TAG@ 5149' START DRILLIG OUT CEMENT
LD PK DOWN TO 5253' ROLL HOLE CLEAN EOT AT 5247' CLOSE WELL IN FOR
NIGHT
14 110/22/2010 06:00 7.15 | 10/22/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP MAKE |10/22/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP MAKE A JNT TAG 5252' START DRILLING 13.50 | DFW_WV310User
A UNT TAG 5252' START DRILLING OUT CEMENT CLEAN OUT TO 5436' ROLL HOLE CLEAN TEAT SQUEEZE
QUT CEMENT CLEAN OUT TO 5436 TO 500 PSI LOST 70 PSI IN 5 MIN BLEED OFF LD 1 JNT CLOSE WELL IN
ROLL H FOR WEEKEND CLEAN UP, LOST 0 BBLS, 184' DRILLED TO DAY EOT AT
5405'
15]10/25/2010 06:00 7.73|10/25/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP RD 10/25/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP RD POWER SWIVEL POOH LD MILL, 14.00 | DFW_WV310User
POWER SWIVEL POOH LD MILL, MAKE UP 6 1/8" PDC BIT TRIP IN TAG @ 5436' RU P,S START DRILLING
! MAKE UP 6 1/8" PDC BIT TRIP IN TAG |OUT CEMENT DOWN TO 5656' TEST SQUEEZE TO 500 LOST 500 PSI IN
@ 5436 2MIN ROLL HOLE CLEAN LD 1JNT EOT@5624' CLEAN UP, SHUT DOWN
FOR NIGHT
16 {10/26/2010 06:00 8.19/10/26/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP TEST |10/26/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP TEST SQUEEZE TO 500PSI LOST 250 IN 11.00 |DFW_WV310User
SQUEEZE TO 500PSI LOST 250 IN 5MIN TRIP INTAG AT 5656' CLEAN OUT TO 5810' ROLL HOLE CLEAN
5MIN TRIP INTAG AT 5656' CLEAN TEST TO 500PSI FOR 5MIN LOST 200 GET INJECTION RATE OF 1/4 BBL
QUTTO PER MIN AT 600 PSI POOH LD PDC BIT CLOSE WELL IN FOR NIGHT
CLEAN UP.
17 110/27/2010 06:00 8.7110,27,2010, TRAVEL CHECK SICP 10,27,2010, TRAVEL CHECK SICP MAKE UP 32A PKR TRIP IN 174 JNTS 12.50 |DFW_WV310User

MAKE UP 32A PKR TRIP IN 174 JNTS
SET PKR @ 5503' TEST CASING TO
500 FOR

SET PKR @ 5503' TEST CASING TO 500 FOR 5MIN LOST 12 GET
INJECTION RATE OF 1/2BBL PER MIN AT 650 PSI RIG UP HALLIBURTION
SQUEEZE CEMENT 25 SACKS OF TYPE 3 CEMENT ISIP 1500 REV CIRC
45 BBLS PSI




43047151570000

Vel | Nunber:

68470 API

Sundry Nunber :

RW 23-13B

Cum Time
Log Time Log Hrs
RPT # End Date (days) Current Ops Summary (hr) Created By
18 10/28/2010 06:00 9.21110/28/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP TEST 10/28/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP TEST SQUEEZE TO 1200 RELEASE PKR 12.00 | DFW_WV310User
SQUEEZE TO 1200 RELEASE PKR POOH LD PKR TRIP IN WITH 6 1/8"™ PDC BIT & 176 JNTS TAG UP AT 5585'
POOH LD PKR TRIP IN WITH 6 1/8"™ RU P,S START DRILLING DOWN TO 5723' TRIP IN TAG PBTD ROLE HOLE
PDC BI CLEAN TEST CASING TO 550 FOR 15MIN LOST 50PSI LD IUNT EOT @
5780
19110/29/2010 06:00 9.77 110/29/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP RU 10/29/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP RU PUMP & POWER SWIVEL TRIP IN 13.50 | DFW_WV310User
PUMP & POWER SWIVEL TRIP IN START DRILLING OUT SHOE SWIVEL BROKE DOWN ROLL HOLE CLEAN
START DRILLING OUT SHOE SWIVEL RD SWIVEL RU NEW SWIVEL START DRILLING ON SHOE CLEAN OUT TO
BROKE DOWN 5816' LD 2 JNTS EQT AT 5780' CLOSE WELL IN FOR WEEKEND
20 (11/1/2010 06:00 10.40 | 11/1/2010,TRAVEL CHECK SIP TRIP IN [11/1/2010,TRAVEL CHECK SIP TRIP IN TAG @ 5814' START DRILLING ON 15.00 [DFW_WV310User
TAG @ 5814' START DRILLING ON SHOE MAKE 2' POOH LD PDC BIT MAKE UP 6 1/8" MILL TRIP IN TAG
SHOE MAKE 2' POOH LD PDC BIT @5816' STAR DRILLING OUT SHOE & OPEN HOLE DOWN TO 5852' ROLL
MAKE U HOLE CLEAN LD 2JNTS EOT @ 5810' CLEAN UP TRAVEL
21111/2/2010 06:00 11.00]11/2/2010, TRAVEL CHECK SIP TRIP IN  [11/2/2010,TRAVEL CHECK SIP TRIP IN 2JNTS TAG AT 5850' CLEAN OUT 14.50 [ DFW_WV310User
2JNTS TAG AT 5850' CLEAN QUT TO TO 5863' ROLL HOLE CLEAN POOH LD 187JNTS RU LONE WOLF SET
5863' ROLL HOLE CLEAN POOH LD PLUG @ 4000' RD WIRE LINE RD RIG FLOOR ND WELL HEAD & BOPS
187 RACK OUT RIG PUMP GET READY TO RIG DOWN CEAN UP TRAVEL
22 111/3/2010 06:00 11.1311/3/2010, TRAVEL RIG DOWN CLEAN 11/3/2010, TRAVEL RIG DOWN CLEAN UP ROAD RIG TO THE RW 33-23B 3.00 [DFW_WWV310User
UP ROAD RIG TO THE RW 33-23B
1111/9/2010 06:00 1.00 |RIG UP & PREPARE TO DRILL FINISH HAULING RIG & SET IN AND RIG UP REPAIRE SPEAR IN DRUM 24.00 |DFW_WV310User
FOR BREAKS
2111/10/2010 06:00 2.00 |PICK UP DRILL PIPE FINISH RIG UP &PICK UP TOP DRIVE, NIPPLE UP & TEST BOP'S INSTALL 24.00 [ DFW_WV310User
WEAR BUSHING, S.M. & RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE AND PICK UP
B.H.A. & DRILL PIPE
3111/11/2010 06:00 3.00 | TRIP FOR BIT#1 PICK UP D.P. DRILL CBP@ 4015' PICK UP PIPE TO 5800' RIG DOWN LAY 24.00 | DFW_WV310User
DOWN MACHINE DRILL CEMENT 7& FLOAT EQUIPMENT FROM 5860' TO
5877 ' PUMP TRIP SLUG & TRIP OUT FOR BIT#1 & MOTOR
4111/12/2010 06:00 4.00 |DRILLING 6.125" HOLE TRIP IN HCLE WITH BIT #1.DRILLING F/5877 T/7700 FIT TEST =9.6 EMW 24.00 |DFW_WV310User
SURVEY@ 6360=1.8* AZM=33.5 SURVEY@7146=3.3* AZM=82.7 RIG
SERVICE &RIG REPAIRE (MUD SAVER VALVE)
5111/13/2010 06:00 5.00 | DRILLING 6.125" HOLE DRILL FROM 7700 TO 9600 RIG SERVICE 24.00 | DFW_WV310User
6{11/14/2010 06:00 6.00 | CIRCULATE FORSHORT TRIP DRILLING F/9600 T/10880 24.00 | DFW_WV310User
7111/15/2010 06:00 7.00 [LAY DOWN BHA CIRC. AND COND. FOR SHORT TRIP,TRIP TO SHOE. CIRC AND COND 24.00 |DFW_WV310User
HCLE FOR LOGS. T.0.0.H. FOR LOGS, LAY DOWN BHA
8111/16/2010 06:00 8.00 [RUN 4 1/2" CASING PICK UP LOGGING TOOLS AND TRIP IN HOLE.WASH 60' TO BOTTOM, 24.00 [DFW_WV310User
CIRCULATE BUTTOMS UP, DEPLOY LOGGING TOOL AND LOG TO
CASING SHOE.T.0.0.H. RIG DOWN LOGGING TOOLS, RIG UP CASERS
AND 4 1/2' CASING.
9{11/17/2010 06:00 9.00 [LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE RUN 4 1/2" CASING,CIRCULTE AND CONDTION HOLE FOR 24.00 |DFW_WV310User
CEMENT.PUMP CEMENT AND RID DOWN CEMENTERS, NIPPLE DOWN
AND SET SLIPS. LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE.
10|11/18/2010 06:00 10.00 |RIG DOWN TO MOVE TO RW 12-27B LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE IN MOUSE HOLE AND CLEAN MUD TANKS, RIG 24.00 [DFW_WV310User

DOWN




43047151570000

Vel | Nunber:

68470 API

Sundry Nunber :

RW 23-13B

Cum Time -
Log Time Log Hrs
RPT # End Date (days) Current Ops Summary (hr) Created By
112/3/2011 06:00 0.33|TIGHT HOLE - Perforate and frac Mesa | TIGHT HOLE - Perforate and frac Mesa Verde Intervals. 8.00 | DFW_WV310User
Verde Intervals. ,
2 12/4/2011 06:00 0.67 | Tight Hole - 2/3/11 FCP = 500# on a Tight Hole - 2/3/11 FCP = 5004# on a 14/64™ w/ show of gas at a flow rate of 8.00 |DFW_WV310User
14/64"" w/f show of gas at a flow rate of 60 BPH.
60 BPH.
3(3/16/2011 06:00 1.00 |MOVE RIG FROM BW-15-18-7-22 TO 3/16/11 ROAD RIG TO LOCATION. MIRU. SPOT EQUIPMENT. SDFD. 8.00 [DFW_WWV310User
RW 23-13B
413/17/2011 06:00 1.54 |RU AND RIH WITH WL SET KILL PLUG  [3/17/11: FCP= 4974# PSI. RIH WITH WL AND SET KILL PLUG@ 3505". RIH 13.00 [DFW_WV310User
WITH TBG. DRILLED UP KILL PLUG. TURN WELL UP SALES LINE. SDFN.
53/18/2011 06:00 2.08 [CONTINUED TO TALLY, RABBIT AND 3/18/11: FCP= 600# PSI. CONTINUE RIH WITH TBG. DRILLED UP FRAC 13.00 [DFW_WV310User
RIH WITH TBG. PLUGS. LANDED TBG. PUMPED BIT OFF. SWI. TURNED WELL OVER TO
PRODUCTION.
613/21/2011 06:00 2.23 |RDMO. FINAL REPORT 3/21/11: SICP= 1300# PSI. FTP=1050# PSI. RDMO. FINAL REPORT. 3.50 | DFW_WV310User
119/26/2011 06:00 0.35 [N.D. WELL HEAD 09/26/2011: MIRU ON 09/23/2011, FTP= 200 PSI SICP = 300 PSI, PUMP 8.50 | DFW_WV310User
10 BBL KILL DOWN TBG , EOT@ 10322' F-NIPPLE @ 10287', WELL IS
SHUT IN, FINAL REPORT
1(7/16/2013 06:00 PULL PLUNGER 06376
1111/22/2014 06:00 RUN BROACH 06376
1111/12/2015 06:00 0.52 |MIRU 11/11/15; Road rig and equip 5 miles to location. Spot in and rig up. X-O to 2 12.50 | temptwilliams
3/8" tbg equip on rig and bop's. Bleed well off. ND well head. NU 5k bop's. RU
floor. Pooh with tubing hanger and production tbg per design. RIH with 3 3/4"
mill, 4 1/2" scraper, 160 joint's of 2 3/8" J-55 tbg. EOT @5152". Shut tbg in.
Turn casing up sales line for night. SDFN
2(11/13/2015 06:00 0.98 | Bleed well off 11/12/15: Bleed well off. RIH with 160 joint's of 2 3/8" J-55 tbg. EOT @10,100". 11.00 | temptwilliams
Pooh LD 320 joint's of 2 3/8" J-55 tbg and bit and scraper. RD floor. ND bop's.
NU 3 valve 10k frac tree. Shut well in. Rig down rack out equip. Read rig and
equip 2 miles to the RW 12B4-23B. Spot to side of location. SDFN
3(11/18/2015 06:00 0.98 LOADED TRAILER AND STRUNG OUT 7 LENGTH FOR ROAD CROSSING 50379
1111/19/2015 06:00 RUN PULLING TOOL, LATCHED BUMPER SPRING HIT ALOT AND 50379
REALLY HARD UNTIL SHEARED OFF, BUMPER SPRING WILL NOT COME
LOOSE
4111/21/2015 06:00 1.29 | MIRU Cutters wire line 11/20/15: RIH with 4 1/2" Halliburton 15k CFP. Set plug @10,062". MIRU hot 7.50 [temptwilliams

oilier to casing and fill hole with 150 bbl's of 2% kel water. Pressure test to
7216 #psi on casing and frac tree for 10 min. Good test. Bleed well off. RIH
with 3 1/8" gun, 3 SPF, 120 phasing. Shoot new perfs from 9806'-10,041".
Correlate to Lone Wolf CBL dated 1/18/11 back to Weatherford compensated
dual neutron dated 10/16/10 ) OPressure increase on well bore. Shut well in for
frac. RD wire line. SDFN
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11/24/2015 06:00

2.15

MIRU Nasco FBE, Cutters ELU and HES
frac equipment.

MIRU Nasco FBE, Cutters ELU and HES frac equipment. Prime up and test
HES lines to 8,200 psi. Good test. Frac stage #1. Plug, perf and frac stages #2
and #3. Set kill plug at 7,000'. Bleed pressure off and SIW. RDMO Nasco FBE,
Cutters ELU and HES frac equipment. Turn well over to production group for
drill out.

20.50

seiffert.contractor

11/25/2015 06:00

2.69

MIRU Basin rig #4

11/24/15: MIRU Basin rig #4. Bleed well off. ND frac tree. NU 5k bop's and
annular. RU fioor and rig up pump line's. Tally, rabbit & pick up pump off bit
sub with mill, 155 joint's of 2 3/8" J-55 tbg. Tag up on kill plug @5000'. RU
swivel and rig pump. Pressure test annular to 1200 #psi. Good test. Test pipe
ram's to 4000 #psi. Good test. RU swivel. Drill kill plug out in 15 min. Run 2-4k
WOB, swivel rpm 110, Pump rate of 2 bpm. Hold 500 #psi back pressure.
Stand swivel back. Tally and pick up 30 joint's. EOT @6060'. Shut and lock
pipe ram's. Trap bop's and RU heater. Turn well over to flow back crew.
Flowing casing pressure 1000 #psi. Flowing back 80 to 100 bph. Rig crew
SDFN

13.00

temptwilliams

11/26/2015 06:00

3.2

=

Drill out plug's

11/25/15: Bleed thg off. Tally, rabbit and pick up 110 joint's of 2 3/8" J-55 tbg.
tag up on CFP @9545'. RU swivel and pump. Drill plug out in per design.
Clean out to CFP @10,062". Roll hole clean. Pooh LD 26 joint's of 2 3/8" J-55
thg. Rig down swivel. Make up tbg hanger. Shut well in and land tbg hanger
in well head. Bleed bop's off. RD floar. ND bop's. NU well head. Shut tbg in
and lock it out. Turn casing over to flow back crew. Note pump off bit sub s
on EOT. Landed EOT @9292'. Rig down rack out equip. Move rig off location.
SDFN

12.50

temptwilliams

=

11/28/2015 06:00

CONTRACT WORK

50379

2]

12/1/2015 06:00

3.21

CONTRACT WORK

50379

w

12/2/2015 06:00

3.21

CONTRACT WORK

50379

12/5/2015 06:00

3.21

12/4/2015 20 RUNS 498 BBLS 12/5/2015 9 RUNS 720 BBLS

50379




Sundry Nunber: 68470 APl Well Nunber: 43047151570000

‘ ,EP Perforations
‘ENERGY:..

Well Name: RW 23-13B
API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Configuration Type
43-047-15157 S13-T7S-R23E RED WASH UINTAH UTAH S-Well
Unigue Well ID GrElev (ft) Current Elevation KB to CF (ft) Spud Date Dry Hole TD Date Total Depth (All) {ft, KB;
UT101250 5,771 5,785.00, <elvothernote> 14.00 10/12/1953 00:00 |3/21f20‘| 1 00:00 ORIGINAL HOLE - 10,880.0

OPEN

S-Well - ORIGINAL HOLE, 12/21/2015 2:40:50 PM Perforations | ‘ TR {liilhy
Vertical schematic (actual) Zone (Completion Interval) |Date Linked Zone Top Depth (ft, KB) Bottom Depth (ft, KB)
11/23/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE | 9,320 9,322
" Perforation Company Canveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrier Make
Shot Density (shotsft) Charge Type Phasing ()
3.0
Orientation Orientation Method
Over/Under Balanced |P Over/Under (psi) FL MD Before (ft, KB) |FL MD After (it, KB) P Surf Init {psi) P Final Surf (psi)
1,770 1,660
Reference Log
~49,394.0- —
9.396.0 Calculated Shot Total
9,403.0- 7
gigg-g Perforation Statuses i
9:440:0 Date | Status Cam
9,505.0-
9,507.0 Date Linked Zone Top Depth {ft, KB) Bottom Depth (ft, KB)
9,522.0- 11/23/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE | 9,350 9,351
9,525.0 Perforation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrier Make
-19,570.0-
2 19,572.0 Shot Density (shots/t) Charge Type Phasing (*)
=19,688.0- 3.0
7}9:590.0 Orientation Orientation Method
< 19,623.0-
= 19,625.0 - — - -
“Fo 541.0- Over/Under Balanced |P Over/Under (psi) FL MD Before (ft, KB) |FL MD After (ft, KB) P Surf Init (psi) P Final Surf (psi)
=1 B 1,770 1,660
5 9,668.0- Reference Log
- 19,670.0
= 09,706.0- Calculated Shot Total
=9,708.0 4
< 19,724.0- 7
Tlo.795.0 Perforation Statuses |
= o 740.0- Date Status! Com i
= 19,742.0
- 19,806.0- Date Linked Zone Top Depth (ft, KB) Bottom Depth (ft, KB}
- 19,808.0 11/23/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE | 9,394 9,396
B gg;i’g‘ Perforation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrier Make
9,817.0- Shot Density (shots/ft) Charge Type Phasing ()
zfo.919.0 20
= 19924.0- _ . ’ ,
- 9,026.0 Orientation Orientation Method
- 19,945.0-
- 9,847.0 OveriUnder Balanced |P Over/Under (psi) FL MD Before (ft, KB) |FL MD After (ft, KB) P Surf Init (psi} P Final Surf (psi}
i19,957.0- 1,770 1,660
: 9,959.0 Reference Log
L+ 110,021.0-
=] 10,023.0 Calculated Shot Total
i10,039.0- 7
f‘__ 10,041.0 5
. 110,082 0- Perforation Statuses
- 110,096.0; | Date Status Com
4 2/2/2011,
v | OPEN
vl 10.272.0- Date Linked Zone Top Depth (ft, KB) Bottom Depth (ft, KB}
4 110.284.0: 11/23/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE | 9,403 9,405
3 2/2{2011, Perforation Company Conveyance Methed Gun Size (in) Carrier Make
10,064.0 + t:‘ OPEN
[ < 110,476.0- Shot Density (shots/ft) Charge Type Phasing (*)
51 10,482.0; 3.0
- [ 202/2011, S _
OPEN Onientation Ornentation Method
21 10,490.0- _ PR -
v | 10.496.0: OverfUnder Balanced |P Over/Under (psi) FL MD Before (it, KB) |FL MD After (f, KB) P Surf Init {psi) P Final Surf (psi}
({2/2/2011, 1,770 1,660
: OPEN Reference Log
4 110,504.0-
0,508.0; Calculated Shot Total
2/2/2011, 7
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Sundry Nunber: 68470 APl Well Nunber: 43047151570000
‘ ' EP Perforations
L N
ENERGYw
Well Name: RW 23-13B
AP Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Configuration Type
43-047-15157 S13-T78-R23E RED WASH UINTAH UTAH S-Well
Unigue Well ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation K8 to CF (ft) Spud Date Dry Hole TD Date Total Depth (Al (ft, KB
uT101250 5771 5,785.00, <elvothernote> 14.00 10/12/1953 00:00 3/21/2011 00:00 CRIGINAL HOLE - 10,880.0
S-Well - ORIGINAL HOLE, 12/21/2015 2:40:50 PM Perforation Statuses Il TFERTIEH
Vertical schematic (actual) Zone {Completion Interval) Date i Status i | Com’
T Ly, St
% Date Linked Zone Top Depth (ft, KB) Bottom Depth (ft, KB)
i 11/23/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE | 9,436 9,440
it 2; ROD Perforation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrier Make
2 STRING;
; (0.0- Shot Density (shotsfft) Charge Type Phasing ()
; [5,110.0 3.0
J gg;gg- Orientation Orientation Method
I |9.350.0-
: 9,351.0 Qver/Under Balanced |P Over/Under (psi) FL MD Before (ft, KB) |FL MD After (ft, KB) P Surf Init (psi) P Final Surf (psi)
‘9,394.0- — 1,770 1,660
9,396.0 Reference Log
9,403.0-
| 9,405.0 Calculated Shot Total
- 19,436.0- 13
= [9,440.0 i o ~
: |o,505.0- Perforation Statuses | !
- 19,507.0 Date Status I ‘ Com
- 19,522.0-
F§0.025.0 Data Tinked Zone Top Depth (L, KB) Bottorn Depth (, KB)
: gg;gg 11/23/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE | 9,505 9,507
9‘588:0- Perforation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size (in} Carrier Make
=19,590.0 _
5 9,623.0- Shot Density (shotsift) Charge Type Phasing (%)
Tlo 6250 3.0
- 9,641.0- Orientation Orjentation Method
=19,643.0
= [9,668.0- OverfUnder Balanced |P OverfUnder (psi) | FL MD Before (it, KB) | FL MD After (ft, KB) | P Surf Init (psi) P Final Surf (psiy
9,670.0 1,770 1,660
= 19,706.0- Reference Log
#19,708.0
9,724.0- Calculated Shot Total
197260 7
: =19,740.0- . T
' 19,7420 Perforation Statuses
- §9,806.0- Date |11 Status Com!
- 19,808.0
2 19,819.0- .
A ] 9821.0 Date Linked Zone Top Depth (ft, KB) Bottom Depth (ft, KB)
; looi70 11/23/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE | 9,522 9,525
Z§9.919.0 Perforation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrier Make
[19.924.0-
7§9,926.0 Shot Density (shots/ft) Charge Type Phasing (%)
2 19,945.0- 3.0
- 9,947.0 Orientation Orientation Method
3 £ 9,957.0-
B 1]9.959.0 OverlUnder Balanced |P OverfUnder (psl) | FL MD Before (it KB) |FL MD Afier (%, KB) | P SurfInt (ps) P Final Surf (psi)
b - ROcs 1,770 1,660
_" "_ 0,023 Reference Log
e (] 10,039.0-
3'" ‘; 10,041.0 Frrermnes
0 10,082.0- Calculated Shot Total
| 10,096.0; 10
2 2/2/2011, 3, g [
Hloren Perforation Statuses .
'10!272_0_ Date | Status Com
10,284.0;
10,062.0; 2/2/2011, Date Linked Zone Top Depth (ft, KB) Bottom Depth (ft, KB}
10,064.0 | OPEN 11/23/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE | 9,570 9,572
1 13;;23; Perforation Company Caonveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrier Make
e | 2122011, _
OPEN Shot Density (shots#t) |Charge Type Phasing (°)
10,490.0- 3.0
- | 10,496.0; Crientation Orientation Method
od 21212011,
L | OPEN Gver/Under Balanced |P Over/Under (psi) | FL MD Before (f, KB) | FL MD After (i, KB) | P Surf Inkt (psi) P Final Surf (psi)
e 10,504.0- | 1,408 1,460
1 10.608.0; Reference Lag
= 2/2/2011,
% OPEN
: Calculated Shot Total
7
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Sundry Nunber: 68470 APl Well Nunber: 43047151570000
‘ ' EP Perforations
N
ENERGYw
Well Name: RW 23-13B
APl Surface Legal Location Field Name County State ‘Well Configuration Type
43-047-15157 S13-T7S8-R23E RED WASH UINTAH UTAH S-Well
Unique Well ID GrElev (it) Current Elevation KB to CF (ft) Spud Date Dry Hole TD Date Total Depth (All) {ft, KB)
uT101250 5,771 5,785.00, <elvothemote> 14.00 10/12/1953 00:00 |3/21/2011 00:00 ORIGINAL HOLE - 10,880.0

S-Well - ORIGINAL HOLE, 12/21/2015 2:40:50 PM

Perforation Statuses

=1 10,490.0-

Vertical schematic (actual) Zone (Completion Interval) Date Status Com
LT G T T T
‘l%’ Date Linked Zone Top Depth {ft, KB) Bottom Depth (ft, KB)
: i 11/23/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE | 9,588 9,590
2; ROD Perforation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size (in} Carrier Make
STRING;
0.0- Shot Density (shots/ft) Charge Type Phasing (%)
5,110.0
9,320.0 49
9:322:0_ Orientation Orientation Method
9,350.0-
9,351.0 Over/Under Balanced |P Over/Under (psi) FL MD Before (ft, KB) |FL MD After (ft, KB) P Surf Init (psi) P Final Surf (psi)
9,394.0- - 1‘405 1 1460
9,396.0 Reference Log
9,403.0-
9,405.0 Calculated Shot Total
9,436.0- 7
9,440.0 2 T .
9.505.0- Perforation Statuses I
% [9,907.0 . Date Status Com
= 19,522.0-
= 195250 Date Linked Zone Top Depth (t, KB) Bottom Depth (t, KB)
:+19,570.0- 11/23/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE | 9,623 9,625
+ 19,5720 - e -
o 5880 Perforation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrier Make
+{9.590.0 _ _
+19,623.0- Shat Density (shots/ft) Charge Type Phasing (%)
Tlo625.0 3.0
: 9,641.0- Crientation Orizntation Method
“19,643.0
2. § 9,668.0- OverfUnder Balanced |P Over/Under (psi} FL MD Before (ft, KB) |FL MD After (ft, KB) P Surf Init (psi) P Final Surf (psi)
1{9,670.0 1,406 1,460
9,708.0- Reference Log
:9,708.0
i ]9.724.0- Calcuated Shot Tola)
19,725.0 7
49,740.0-
< 9,742.0 Perforation Statuses
-« 9,806.0- Date Status Com
[ §9,808.0
={9,819.0- :
98010 Date Linked Zane Top Depth (ft, KB) Bottom Depth (fi, KB)
o517 6 11/23/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE | 9,641 9,643
9:919_0 Perforation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrier Make
f19,924.0-
: 9,926.0 Shot Density (shots/t) Charge Type Phasing (*)
. §0,945.0- 3.0
+-19,947.0 Orientation Orientation Method
={9.957.0-
7]9.959.0 Gver/Under Balanced | P OverlUnder (psi)  |FL MD Before (1, KB) | FL MD After (i, KB) | P SCif Init {psi) P Final Surf (psi)
< §10,021.0- 1,406 1,460
= 110,023.0
= Reference Log
—110,029.0-
=410,041.0
= 10.082.0- Caleulated Shot Tetal
10,096.0; 7
5 gg’éﬁm Perforation Statuses
:::: 10,272.0- Date Status Com
7 110,284.0;
5 | 2/2/2011, Date Linked Zone Top Depth (ft, KB) Botton Depth {ft, KB)
10,064.0 - | OPEN 11/23/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE | 9,668 9,670
| 13*2228‘ Perforation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrier Make
2 [2r202011,
= |OPEN Shot Density (shots/ft) Charge Type Phasing (%)

3.0

10,496.0; Orientation Orientation Method

2212011,
- | OPEN Over/Under Balanced |P OverUnder (psi) | FL MD Before (i, KB) |FL MD Afler (ft, KB) | P Surf Init (psi) P Final Surf (psi)
L 1050H0- 1,406 1,460
| 10,508.0; —— -
:__:_ 2/2’2011‘ elerence Log
£ OPEN
- Calculated Shot Total
7
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Sundry Nunber: 68470 APl Well Nunber: 43047151570000
O EP Perforations
-ENEP.GY.J
Well Name: RW 23-13B
API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Configuration Type
43-047-15157 S13-T7S-R23E RED WASH UINTAH UTAH S-Well
Unique Well ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KB to CF (ft) Spud Date Dry Hole TD Date Total Depth (All) (ft, KB
uT101250 5,771 5,785.00, <elvothernote> 14.00 10/12/1953 00:00 3/21/2011 00:00 ORIGINAL HOLE - 10,880.0
S-Well - ORIGINAL HOLE, 12/21/2015 2:40:51 PM Perforation Statuses i | |
Vertical schematic (actual) Zone (Completion Interval) Date Status L Com 1l
1= Date Linked Zone Top Depth {it, KB) Bottom Depth (it, KB)
g 5 11/23/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE [ 9,706 9,708
2; ROD Perforation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size (in} Carrier Make
STRING;
2?1 - Shot Densily (Shots/i) Charge Type Fhasing (")
* [9,3200 20
9:322: 0' Crientation Orientation Method
9,350,0-
: [9,351.0 OverfUnder Balanced |P Over/Under (psi} FL MD Before {ft, KB) |FL MD After (ft, KB) P Surf Init {psi) P Final Surf (psi)
4109,394.0- —| 1,406 1,460
- [9,396.0 Reference Log
= | 9,403.0-
9,405.0 Caleulated Shot Total
9,436.0- 7
9,440.0 =
9.505.0- Perforation Statuses || |
= [9,507.0 Date | Status Com|
- 19,522.0-
19,5250 Date Tinked Zone Top Depih (T, KB) Bottom Depth (1t, KB)
19,5700 11/23/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE (9,724 9,726
= §9,572.0 - — -
o 5880 Perforation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrler Make
=19,590.0 e -
9623.0- Shot Density (shots/t) Charge Type Phasing (°)
“ 19,6250
% ~19,641.0- Qrientation Orientation Method
< ={o.643.0
- | 9,668.0- Over/Under Balanced [P Over/Under (psi) FL MD Before (ft, KB) |FL MD After (ft, KB) P Surf Init (psi) P Final Surf (psi)
7{:‘ 119,670.0 1,406 1,460
o =49,706.0- Reference Log
=19,708.0
2 ]9,724.0- Calculated Shet Total
9,726.0 7
= 9,740.0- . -
= 19,742.0 Perforation Statuses!
- |9,806.0- Date Status | Com |
- 19,308.0
=19,819.0- -
“Ho8210 Date Linked Zone Top Depth (ft, KB) Bottom Depth (i, KB)
- pemd 11/23/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE | 9,740 9,742
=§5915.0 Perferation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrier Make
i 9,924.0-
z " 9,926.0 Shot Density (shotsfft) Charge Type Phasing (*)
i i [9,945.0- 3.0
e o [9,947.0 Orientation Crientation Method
B £ [9,957.0-
E i 19.959.0 OverfUnder Balanced |P Overunder (ps) | FL MD Bafore (%, KB) |FL MD After (% KB) [P Surf Ik (o1} P Final Sur (psh
= 1110,021.0-
| | 1,406 1,460
ﬁ" o 10,023.0 Reference Log
Eo F-110,039.0-
j‘; :-: 10,041.0
B  [110,082.0- Calculated Shot Total
2 110,096.0; 7
) 2/2/2011, 7 :
< Jopen Perforation Statuses | |
=l 10.272.0- Date Status Com
= 110,284.0;
21212011, Date Linked Zone Top Depth (ft, KB) Bottom Depth (f, KB)
10,064.0 | OPEN 11/20/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE | 9,806 9,808
I f ]8:;33‘ Perforation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrier Make
2 (2202011, Cutters ere line 31/8 ‘
't | OPEN Shot Density (shots/ft) Charge Type Phasing ()
110,450.0- 3.0 120
- | 10,496.0; Crientation Orientation Method
[+ 42/2/2011,
L ‘113(;’55{;“4 4 Gver/Under Balanced | P OveriUnder (psi) |FL WD Betors (%, KE) |FL WD After (ft, KB) [P Sur Ini (ps) P Final Surt (psi}
b 10, -U-
L= 10,508.0;
:-f'_b2f2f2011, Reference Log

. OPEN

Calculated Shot Total
7
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Sundry Nunber: 68470 APl Well Nunber: 43047151570000
‘ D EP Perforations
ENERGY-
Well Name: RW 23-13B
API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Configuration Type
43-047-15157 S13-T75-R23E RED WASH UINTAH UTAH S-Well
Unique Well ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KB 1o CF (it) Spud Dale Cry Hole TD Dale Total Depth (All) (ft, KB
uT101250 5771 5,785.00, <elvothernote> 14.00 10/12/1953 00:00  |3/21/2011 00:00 ORIGINAL HOLE - 10,880.0
S-Well - ORIGINAL HOLE, 12/21/2015 2:40:51 PM Perforation Statuses | |
Vertical schematic (actual) Zone (Completion Interval) | Date Status'| Com
Date Linked Zone Top Depth (ft, KB) Bottom Depth {ft, KB)
11/20/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE | 9,819 9,821
2; ROD Perforation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrier Make
STRING; Cutters Wire line 31/8
0.0- Shot Density (shots/ft) Charge Type Phasing (%)
5,110.0
90,0 3.0 120
9:322;0' Crientation Orientation Method
9,350.0-
9.351.0 OverfUnder Balanced |P Over/Under (psi) FL MD Before (ft, KB) |FL MD After (ft, KB) P Surf Init (psi) P Final Surf (psi)
9,394.0- —
x 19,396.0 Reference Log
= |9,403.0-
] 9,405.0 Calculated Shot Total
9,436.0- 7
9,440.0 7
9,505.0- Perforation Statuses | i
9,607.0 Date Status Com
249,522.0-
= 19.525.0 Date [inked Zone Top Depth (1, KB) Bottom Depth (t, KB)
- g'g;gg’ 11/20/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE |9,917 9,919
& 9,538.0 Perforation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrier Make
& 9‘590'0* Cutters Wire line 31/8
> 9:623:0— Shot Density (shots/ft) Charge Type Phasing (*)
9,625.0 120
=19,641.0- Orientation Orientation Method
19,6430
9,668.0- CverfUnder Balanced |P Over/Under (psi) FL MD Before (1t, KB) |FL MD After (t, KB) | P Surf Init (psi) P Final Surf (psi)
9,670.0
@) 9,706.0- Reference Log
+19,708.0
= §9,724.0- Calculated Shot Total
= 49.726.0 7
= 19,740.0- ‘
= 19,742.0 Perforation Statuses
,: 19,806.0- Date i Status Com
- 19,808.0
= 19,819.0-
2198210 Date Linked Zone Top Depth (ft, KB} Bottomn Depth (ft, KB)
“loo17.0. 11/20/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE | 9,924 9,926
= 19,9180 Perforation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrier Make
= 1o 02400 Cutters Wire line 31/8
“' 8,926.0 Shot Density (shots/t) Charge Type Phasing (°)
. §0,045.0- 3.0
- 49,947.0 Orientation Orientation Method
< 10,957.0-
| ?E?S;Dg OverlUnder Balanced | P OvarfUndar (psh) |FL MD Bafore (7, KB) | FL MD Afier (I, KB) | P Surf Inil (ps)) P Final Surf (psi)
10,0230
| 10.030.0- Reference Log
p ] 10,041.0 _
- 10,082.0- Calculated Shot Total
+[[10,005.0; 7
Al 2/212011, : i
| opEn Perforation Statuses
10,2720 Date Status Com
| 10,284.0;
[ 272/2011, Date Linked Zone Top Depth (it KB) Botlom Depth (it, KB)
| OREN 11/20/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE | 9,945 9,047
'_ 182;23‘ Perforation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrier Make
5 2@,2011: Cutters Wire line 31/8
- 1lOPEN Shot Density (shots/t) Charge Type Phasing (*)
< 110,490.0- 3.0 120
- | 10,496.0; Crientation Orientation Method
= 121242011,
B 10['1355[')\[4 o GverfUnder Balanced |P Overnder (psl) | FL WD Befors (T, KB) |FL MD After (i, KB] | P SUrfInt (psh) P Final S (psi)
> 10,508.0;
" 2122011, Referance Log
;. OPEN
5 Calculated Shot Total
7
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Sundry Nunber: 68470 APl Well Nunber: 43047151570000

‘ ) EP Perforations
‘E!JE&‘GY:.

Well Name: RW 23-13B
API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Configuration Type
43-047-15157 813-T78-R23E RED WASH UINTAH UTAH S-Well
Unigue Well ID Gr Elev (ft) Current Elevation KB to CF (ft) Spud Date Dry Hole TD Date Total Depth (All) (ft, KB
uT101250 5771 5,785.00, <elvothernote> 14.00 10/12/1953 00:00 |3/21/2011 00:00 ORIGINAL HOLE - 10,880.0

S-Well - ORIGINAL HOLE, 12/21/2015 2:40:51 PM

Perforation Statuses

Verlical schematic (actual) Zone (Completion Interval) Date i . Status Com !
o ] AL TLGTT =
Date Linked Zone Top Depth (ft, KB) Bottom Depth (ft, KB}
11/20/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE | 9,957 9,959
2; ROD Perforation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrler Make
STRING; Cutters Wire line 31/8
0.0- Shot Density (shots/ft) Charge Type Phasing (%)
5,110.0 3.0 120
g'gggg_ Crientation Orientation Method
T |9,350.0-
: [9,351.0 Over/Under Balanced |P Over/Under (psi) FL MD Before (ft, KB) |FL MD After (ft, KB) P Surf Init (psi) P Final Surf (psi)
19,394.0- —
v [9,396.0 Reference Log
. 19,403.0-
9,405.0 Calculated Shot Total
9,436.0- 7
9,440.0 H
9,505.0- Perforation Statuses | i il
2 12,507.0 Date Status Com|
m - 19,522.0-
i = 19,525.0 Date [inked Zone Top Depth (ft, KB) Botiom Depth (1T, KB)
2] 2,570.0- 11/20/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE | 10,021 10,023
= 19,572.0 Faroral — -
] P erforation C?mpa_ny Conveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrier Make
= 5000 Cutters Wire line 31/8
9:6231& Shot Density (shots/t) Charge Type Phasing (°)
= |9.625.0 3.0 120
=1[9,641.0- Crientation Crientation Method
=19,643.0
i 9,668.0- Over/Under Balanced |P Over/Under (psi) FL MD Before (ft, KB) [FL MD After {ft, KB) P Surf Init (psi) P Final Surf {psi}
= 19,670.0
=119,706.0- Reference Log
=19,708.0
x9,724.0- Calouiated Shot Total
> §9.726.0 7
= 19,740.0- : : T
=49,742.0 Perforation Statuses
- {©,806.0- Date Status CBmii ]
= 19,808.0
=19,819.0- :
=la'821.0 Date Linked Zone Top Depth {ft, KB) Bottom Depth (ft, KB}
H gz 11/20/2015 MESAVERDE, ORIGINAL HOLE | 10,039 10,041
; 9:919_0 Perforation Cr:'mpa.ny Conveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrier Make
= 19,924.0- Cutters Wire line 31/8
"' 9,926.0 Shot Density (shots#t) Charge Type Phasing (°)
- [9,945.0- 3.0 120
2 [9.947.0 Crientation Orentation Method
“{o.957.0-
A ?6922»100 Over/Under Balanced |P Over/Under (psf) | FL MID Befors (f, KB) | FL MD After (ft, KB) lP Surt nit (ps) F Final Surf (psi}
138523‘ Reference Log
110,041.0 .
10,082.0- Calculated Shot Total
= 110,006.0; 7
= 42/212011, 3
< loren Perf[?ar:tlon Statuses Ll L
Frac plug; 1 ]10,272.0-
41/2; + 110,284.0;
10,062.0: 5 21212011, Date Linked Zone Top Depth (ft, KB) Bottorn Depth (ft, KB)
10,064.0 4 ] OPEN 2/2/2011 10,082 10,096
& 1344;33‘ Perforation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrier Make
= L2011 LONE WOLF WL 0.0
'k OPEN Shot Density (shots/t) Charge Type Phasing (7}
= 110,490.0- 3.0 120
10,496.0; Crientation Orientation Method
"‘: 2i2f2011,
2 CPEN Over/Under Balanced |P Over/Under (psi) FL MD Before (ft, KB) |FL MD After (ft, KB) P Surf Init (psi) P Final Surf (psi)
2t 10,504.0- 0.0 0 0 7
1110,508.0;
L2f2,‘2011, Reference Log
. OPEN
t Calculated Shot Total
43
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Sundry Nunber: 68470 APl Well Nunber: 43047151570000
‘ 'Ep Perforations
ENERGY
Well Name: RW 23-13B
API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Configuration Type
43-047-15157 S13-T7S-R23E RED WASH UINTAH UTAH S-Well
Unique Well ID Gr Elev (ff) Current Elevation KB to CF (ft) Spud Date Dry Hole TD Date Total Depth (All) (ft, KB
UT101250 5,771 5,785.00, <elvothernote> 14.00 10/12/1953 00:00 |3/21/2011 00:00 ORIGINAL HOLE - 10,880.0
S-Well - ORIGINAL HOLE, 12/21/2015 2:40:51 PM Perforaticn Statuses
Verlical schematic (actual) Zone (Completion Interval) Date Status Com
. g 2i212011 OPEN
ALY L%, ETNTTTOT IRy
ST Date Linked Zone Top Depth {it, KB) Bottom Depth (ft, KB)
dl 2i212011 10,272 10,284
: 2; ROD Perforation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrier Make
- STRING LONE WOLF WL 0.0
: 0.0 Shot Density (shots/ft) Charge Type Phasing (°)
- |5,110.0
: 3.0 120
- 19,320.0- Oneniat Orientation Methed
F 193220 rientation rientation Metho
T [9.350.0-
t 9,351.0 Over/Under Balanced |P Over/Under (psi) FL MD Eefore {it, KB) |FL MD After (ft, KB) P Surf Init {psi) P Final Surf (psi)
-9,394.0- — 0.0 0 0
= [9,396.0 Reference Log
= [9,403.0-
9,405.0 Calculated Shot Total
. |9,436.0- T
- [9,440.0 7 ]
9.505.0- Perforation Statuses'
9,507.0 i Date Status || | Com
- 19,522.0- 2/2/2011  |OPEN
7 19.525.0 Date Tinked Zone Top Depth (%, KB) Bottorn Depth (t, KB)
- g-g;g-g’ 21212011 10,476 10,482
9,58870 Perforation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size {in} Carrier Make
| i LONE WOLF WL 0.0
5 : ' Shot Density (shots/ft) Charge Type Phasing {°)
< §9,623.0-
7106250 3.0 120
9,641.0- Crientation Orientation Method
50,643.0
- §9,668.0- Qver/Under Balanced |F Over/Under (psi) FL MD Before (ft, KB) |FL MD After (ft, KB) P Surf Init {psi) P Final Surf (psi)
- 19,6700 0.0
9,706.0- Reference Log
9,708.0
1 19,724.0- Calcuiated Shot Total
19,7260 19
=149 ,740.0- .
=9,742.0 Perforation Statuses i
9,806.0- Date Status | Com
5 f;g?gg 2/2/2011 |OPEN
9’32 1: 0_ Date Linked Zone Top Depth (ft, KB) Bottom Depth {ft, KB)
- { iy 2/2/2011 10,490 10,496
ko 9:91 9.0 Perforation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrier Make
215 a0a.0- LONE WOLF WL 0.0
"' 9,926.0 Shot Density (shotsfit) Charge Type Phasing (%)
B - [0.945.0- 3.0 120
e - 19,947.0 Orientation Crientation Method
& =9,957.0-
A el ?‘0932'100 OverlUnder Balanced | P Over/Under (psi} | FL MID Before (ft, KB) | FL MD After (1, KB} 'lP Surf Int (psi) P Final Surt (psh)
S g 19,02 1.0- 0.0 0 0
i - 19.023.0 Reference Log
B =] 10,039.0-
: - 110,041.0
i5 ' 10,082.0- Calculated Shet Total
= | 10,096.0; 19
< = 12/2/2011, o
: | opEN Perf;;:tlon Statuses — -
Frac plug; |3 - 110,272.0-
a“f;jg; 4 102840, 2/2/2011 |OPEN
10,062.0; A= [2/2/2014, Date Linked Zone Top Depth (f, KB) Bottom Depth (ft, KB)
10,064.0 '— £} OPEN 21212011 10,504 10,508
! __ _ 10‘476'0_' Perforation Company Conveyance Method Gun Size (in) Carrier Make
"::' ;?;28021(1) LONE WOLF WL 0.0
" ‘ OPEN Shot Density (shots/ft) Charge Type Phasing (%)
i = 110,490.0- 3.0 120
b 10,496.0; Orientation Orientation Method
“_: (- ]2/2/2011,
: — -— ?OPSEON:I- " Over/Under Balanced [P Over/Under (psi) FL MD Before (ft, KB) |FL MD After (ft, KB) P Surf Init (psi) P Final Surf (psi)
(1S | 10,508.0; Reference [0 = - 2
e =" 212/2011, g
# = OPEN
Calculated Shot Total
13
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Sundry Nunber: 68470 APl Well Nunber: 43047151570000

‘ ’EP Perforations
‘ENERGY".

Well Name: RW 23-13B
API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well Configuration Type
43-047-15157 513-T7S-R23E RED WASH UINTAH UTAH S-Well
Unique Well ID Gr Elev (ft) [ Current Elevation KB to CF (ft) Spud Date Dry Hole TD Date Total Depth (All) (ft, KB)
UT101250 5,771 5,785.00, <elvothernote> 14.00 10/12/1953 00:00 | 3/21/2011 00:00 ORIGINAL HOLE - 10,880.0

S-Well - ORIGINAL HOLE, 12/21/2015 2:40:51 PM

Perforation Statuses |

Vertical schematic (actual) Zone (Completion Interval) |

' Date

| Status

| Com

TRTTTAREATTTTITTITS

; 2; ROD
. STRING;
0.0-
5,110.0
- ]9,320.0-
_] 9,322.0
L (9,350.0-
- 19,351.0
H1-19,394.0- —
. |9,396.0
21 |9,403.0-
" [9.405.0
.+ |9,436.0-
= [9,440.0
9,505.0-
2 [9,507.0
510,622 0-

% 19,525.0

i 0,570.0-

- 49,572.0

= 19,588.0-

=49,590.0

= 19,623.0-

“19,625.0

= 19,641.0-

- 19,643.0

- |9,668.0-

= 9,670.0

2 19,706.0-

2 ho.708.0

8,724.0-

9,726.0

9,740.0-

9,742.0

9,806.0-

- 49,808.0

19,819.0-

= 19,821.0

= 19,917.0-

9,919.0

i

9,924.0-
9,926.0

9,945.0-
9,047.0

9,957.0-
9,959.0

10,021.0-
10,023.0
10,039.0-
10,041.0
10,082.0-
10,096.0;
-r 2/2/2011,
= |OPEN

= 10,272.0-
< 110,284.0;

.-“- (D EIR D

s i e o o A

= [2/2/2011,
2 | OPEN

= 110,476.0-
e [ 10,482.0;
- [2/2/2011,
- | OPEN

= 110,490.0-
10,496.0;
2/2/2011,
OPEN

110,504.0-
110,508.0;
2212011,
. OPEN

21212011 OPEN
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