
Form DOGC-la SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE*

STATE OF UTAH (Other ienstru ions on

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL & GAS 5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

APPUCATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL, DEEPEN,OR PLUG BACK 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

la. Type of Work
7. Uni Agreement NameDRILLg DEEPEN PLUG BACK

b. Type of Well
Oil Gas Gas Storage Single Mumple 8. Farrn or Lease Name
Well Well Other 91ThdTAWRQITTjPCg e Zone

2.NameofOperator CORIVille GSS StOTage

Wexpro Companv
9. Well No.

3. Address of Operator -

, ; * ; 12
10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat

P. 0, Box 458 Rock Sprines, WY A7409 1
4. Location of Well (ReporÊlocation clearly anfm accordance with*tth?¾ftate r re e ts ) GSS Storage

At surface
11. See., T., R., M., or Blk.

NW SE, 2170' FSL, 1449' FEL and survey or Area

At proposed prod. zone

MSION OF 9-2N-5E, SLB&M
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parrish 13. State

One half mile northeast of Coalville, Utah Summit Utah
15. Distance from proposed* 16. No. of acres in lease 17. No. of acres assigned

location to nearest to this well
property or lease line, ft- N/A N/A N/A(Also to nearest dr1g. line, if any)

18. Distance from proposed location* . 19. Proposed den 20. Rotary or cable tools
to nearest well, drilling, completed, yor applied for, on this lease, ft. N/A 2700 Rotary

21. Elevations (Show wŠetÄerDF, RT, GR, etc.) 22. Approx. date work will start*

GR 5617' "as graded" Upon approval
23.

PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

Size of Hole Size of Casing Weight per Foot Setting Depth Quantity of Cement

17-1/2" 13-3/8" 61 120' 170 sxs w/3% CaCl & k# flonele
12-1/4" 9-5/8" 36 1522' 830 sxs w/3% CaC1 & ½# flocele

8-3/4" 7" 20 300' To be determined from caliper
8-3/4" 7" 23 2700' portion of sonic log.

This will be a gas storage injection/withdrawal well. Af ter surface casing set, install
a 13-5/8" 3000 psi hydraulically operated double gate preventer and a 13-5/8" 3000 psi
annular preventer; casing and preventar rams will be pressure tested to 500 psi for 15
minutes. After intermediate casing set, install an 11" 3000 psi double gate hydraulically
operated blow out preventer with 4½" rams in the bottom and blind rams in the top, and an
11" 3000 psi annular preventer; surface casing, all preventer rams and Kelly vlave will be
pressure tested to 2500 psi for 15 minutes using rig pump and mud. All BOP's will have
hand wheels installed which will be operative at time preventers are installed. Mud
program: gel water base mud to 135', mud weight increased to 11.5 ppg with lost circulation
material to prevent expected salt water flows between 300' and 1422' due to presence of
slightly over-pressured salt water sands, remainder of hole also drilled with 11.5 ppg mud
to contain expected gas pressure. Geologic Tops: Frontier - surface; Chalk Creek Member -

1422'; Spring Creek Member - 2107'; Observation Zone - 2267'; Base Obs Zone - 2305'; Long-
wall SS - 2470' As en Shale - 2575'; Kelvin - 2600'. (Continued on Second Sheet)

IN ABOVE SPACE DESCR EP OPOSED PROGRAM: If proposal is to deepen or plug back, give data on present productive zone and proposed new pro-

ductive zone. If proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give pertinent data on subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths. Give blowout

(This space for Federal s 3tate office use)

Permit No......................... ...... ........... Approval Date ......

Approved by......................... ........ ................. Title............................... .. .............. Date........
Conditions of approval, if any:

*See Instructions On Reverse
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Form DOCC-la SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE*
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DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL & GAS Lease Designation and Serial No.

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL, DEEPEN, OR PLUG BACK (i. If Imlian. Allottee or Tribe Name

la. Type of Work
7. Uni Agreement Name

DRILL DEEPEN O PLUG BACK
b. Type of Well

Oil Gas Gas Storage Single Muldple 8. Farm or Lease Name
Well Well Other IJithdTAFTA14/TDjPppg'ge Zone

2. NameofOverator COR1Ville GOS StOTag
9. Well No.

Wexpro Company
3. Address of Operator 12

10. Fieki and Pool, or Wildcat
P. O, Box 458 Rock Sprin 9, WY A9907

4. Location of Well (Repor( location clearly an m accordance with any State requirements.•> Gas Storage
At surface 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk.

NW SE, 2170' FSL, 1449' FEL and Survey or Area
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18. ÖÏÃance from proposed location* 19. Proposed depth 20. Rotary or cable tools
o°r TÏ r"

',"on$s"Îeaffted,N/A 2700 ' Rotary
21. Elevatio (Šhowwhether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 22. Approx. date work will start*

GR 5617' "as graded" Upon approval
23.

PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

Size of Hole Size of Casing Weight per Foot Setting Depth Quantity of Cement

17-1/2" 13-3/8" 61 120' 170 sxs w/32 CaC1 & ¼# flore
12-1/4" 9-5/8" 36 1522' 830 sxs w/3% CaCl_& ½# flocele

8-3/4" 7" 20 300' To be determined from caliper
8-3/4" 7" 23 2700' portion of sonic log.

(Continuation)

Logs: DIL-SFL, CNL-FDC-GR with caliper, BHC-Sonic-GR with caliper, HDT & FIL from
surface casing to total depth. Run DST for any significant gas show from surface
casing to total depth. No
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One half mile northeast of Coalville, Utah Summit Utah
15. Distance from proposed* 16. No. of acres in lease 17. No. of acres assigned

location to nearest to this well
vroverty or lease line, ft. N/A N/A N/A(Also to nearest drig. Iine, if any)

18. ÖÏÃance from proposed location* 19. Proposed depth 20. Rotary or cable tools
o°r TÏ r"

',"on$s"Îeaffted,N/A 2700 ' Rotary
21. Elevatio (Šhowwhether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 22. Approx. date work will start*

GR 5617' "as graded" Upon approval
23.

PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

Size of Hole Size of Casing Weight per Foot Setting Depth Quantity of Cement
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12-1/4" 9-5/8" 36 1522' 830 sxs w/3% CaCl_& ½# flocele

8-3/4" 7" 20 300' To be determined from caliper
8-3/4" 7" 23 2700' portion of sonic log.

(Continuation)

Logs: DIL-SFL, CNL-FDC-GR with caliper, BHC-Sonic-GR with caliper, HDT & FIL from
surface casing to total depth. Run DST for any significant gas show from surface
casing to total depth. No
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STANDARD CHOKE AND KILL REQUIREMENTS

N° ITEM FURNISHEOBY
NOMINAL ID TYPE

OPER. CONTR.
Cross 3" X 3"

19 3" X 2"

20 Gate Valve 1-13/16

21 Compound Pressure Gage

22 Gate Valves 3-1/8

Choke Cam H-2 or23
equilivent 3" 2"

24 Gate Valves 3-1/8"

25 Line 3"

26 Line 3"

27 Line
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STANDARD STACK REQUIREMENTS

FURNISHEDBYN° ITEM NOMINAL ID TYPE
OPER. CONTR.

1 Drilling Nipple

2 Flowline

! 3 Fill up Line 2"
dril4 Annular Preventer meron

Shaffer

5 Two Single or One dual Hydril '
oper rams.

EF
Drilling spool with 3" and 2"

6 outlets
Forged

7
sndA e nageines 6r mRËÛtŸeiË

in this ram

8 Gate Valve 3-1/8

9 Valve-hydraulically operated
(Gate) 3-1/8

10 Choke Line 3"

11 Gate Valves 2-1/16

12 Check Valve 2-1/16

13 Kill Line 2"

14 Gate Valve 2-1/16

15 Kill Line to Pumps 2"

16 Casing Head

Valve Gate
17 Plug 1-13/16

18 Compound Pressure Cage

Wear
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RECONCILEMELL NAMEANDLOCATIONON APD AGAINSTSAMEDATAON PIAT MAP.

AUTHENTICATELEASE ANDOPERATORINEORMATION

VERIFY ADFRUATEANDPROPE BONDING

AUTHENTICATEIF SITE IS IN A NAMEDFTFT.0, ETC.
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UNIT

c-3-b

c-3-c

CHECKDISTANCETO NEARESTWELL.

ARECK OUTSTANDINGOR OVERDUEREPORTSFOR OPERATOR'SOTHER WF118.
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IF IN OIL SHALEDESIGNATEDAREA, SPECIAL APPROVALLANGUAGE.
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November 22, 1983

Wexpro Company
P. O. Box 458
Rock Springs, Wyoming 82902

RE: Coalville Gas Storage #12
NWSESe¢. 9, T. 2N, R. 58
2170* PSL, 1449' PEL
Summit County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Insofar as this office is concerned, approval to drill the above referred to
gas storage well is hereby granted in accordance with the Order issued in Cause
No. 148-1 dated March 14, 1973. (1) Prodnetion of oil or gas from this we11 is not
authorized. It may be used for observation and for gas storage infection or with-
drawal only. Special attention is directed towards blow out prevention. (2) Paior
to spudding, a copy oÈ the Utah Division of Water Rights (801-555-6071) approval
for use or purchase of drilling water must be submitted to this office, otherwise
this approval is void.

Should you determine that it will be necessary to plug and abandon this well,
you are hereby requested to imediately notify the following:

RONALDJ. FIRTH - Chief Petroleum Engineer
Offlee: 533-5771
Home: 571-6068

Enclosed please find Porm OGC-8-X, which is to be completed whether or not
water sands (acquifers) are encountered during drilling. Your cooperation in
completing this form will be appreciated.

Further, it is requested that this Division be notified within 24 hours after
drilling operations comence, and that the drilling contractor and rig number be
identified.

The API number assigned to this well is 43-043-30249.

Sincerely,

Norman C. Stout
Administrative Assistant

NCS/as
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Form OGC-lb SUP TRIPLICATii*

ATE OF UTAH structions on
reverse sigle)

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
D1VIS10N OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION .tND BERIAL NO.

Fee

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-'' for such proposals.) --

1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME°w'L.O ".^."or.O o,... Gas Storage, Withdrawal/Injection Well --

2. NAME OF OPERATOS 8. PARM OR LBASE NAME

Wexpro Company Coalville Gas Storage

8. ADDREER OF OPBBATOR 9. WRI.I. NO.

P. O. Box 458, Rock Springs, WY 82902 12
4. LOCATION 07 wmLL (Report location clearly and in accordance wtth any State requirements.• 10. riaLD AND Poot, on wit.oc&T

See also space 17 below.)
at surface Gas Storage

NW SE, 2170' FSL, 1449' FEL 11. sac..z.,s.,x.,oaar.x.axo
acavar os asaA

9-2N-SE, SLB&M
14. PERot12 NO. 15. ELEVATIONs (Show whether or, at, on, ete.) 12. COONTT 05 PARIBM 18. STATE

43-043-30249 GR 5617' Summit Utah

te· CheckAppropnate BoxTo ladicate Nature of Notice,Report,or Other Data
NOTICS OF INTENTION TO: 80BasQURNT SPORT 07:

TEST WATER BRUT-OPP PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-Orr REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERENG CAstNG

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS X (Other)
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel

(Other) ......J Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CUMPLETI:D OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If weil is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertt•
nont to this work.) *

Change surface casing to following:

- run 500' of 13-3/8-inch 0.D., 54.5-pound, K-55, 8 round thread, ST&C casing

- cement with 600 sacks Regular Type G with 3% CaC1 and 1/4-pound flocele per
sack

Run rotating head as a diverter.

APPROVEDBYTHESTATE
OF UTAH DIVISIO OF £3

GAS,AND 1

18. I hekeby certit a and correct

amnun TITLE Dr111ing Superintendent 12-9-83

(This space for ederal or State omce use)

AFF"MED BT TITLE DATE
CONùnk 'IS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*Seeinstructionson Revene
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WATER PERMIT #83-35-35

DIVISIONOFOIL,GASANDMINING

SPUDDINGINFORMATION

NAFEOFCOFPANY: wexpro

WELLNAFE: Coalville Unit #12 (Gas Storage)

SECTION NWSE 9 IOWNSHIP 2N RANGE 5E COUNTY summit

DRILLINGCONTRACTORMGF

RIG#61

SPUDDO:DATE 12-10-83

IIME 3:00 PM

OW Rotary

DRILLING WILLC0lflENCE

REPORTEDBY Kathy

TELEPHONEg 307-382-9791

12-12=83 SIGNO
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Form OGC-lb SUB IN TRIPIRATE*

STATE OF UTAH (L instructions on
reverse sule)

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 6· 'rass osa!ØNATION ANO 88RIAL NO.

Fee
6. 17 INDIAN, ALLOTTES OR TRIBE NAMESUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS --

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for auch proposals.)

L 7. UNIT AGaggMENT NAME
°w','em O °w^="to O 42... Gas Storage - Withdrawal/Injection Well --

2. NAME 07 OPERATOR 8. PARAt Om LBASE NAME

Wexpro Company Coalville Gas Storae
3. ADDERES 07 OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

P. O. Box 458, Rock Springs, WY 82902 12
4. r.OCATION or wmLL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirementa.• 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCATSee also space 17 below.)at surfac• Gas Storage

NW SE, 2170' FSL, 1449' FEL 11. aa T.,s..x..oaar.x.ano

9-2N--5E, SLB&M
14. PERMIT NO. 1ô. ELavATroNa (Show whether or, xT, an, eto.) 12. CooNor os FAarsa 18. sTArs

GR 5617' Summit Utah

te· CheckAppropnate BoxTo Indicate Natureof Notice,Report,or Other Data
NOTICS OP INTENTION TO: SUSSEQUENT EMPORT 07:

TEST WATER SHUT-Orr PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT•Orr REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOUTING OR ACIDIžING ABANDONMENT*

REFAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other) Supplemental History x
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel(Other) ('ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMI'LETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pert1-
nent to this work.) *

SPUDDED December 10, 1983 at 3:00 P.M.

Depth 520', drilling.

DNiŠl0NOF
GL GAS&M NG

iä. I hereby certify at the foregoing is true and correct

SIGNED TITLE nrilling Superintendent vars 12-14-83

(This space for Federal or State ofice use)

APP"ovED BT TITLE DATE
COLuu 5 OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructionson Reverse

Form OGC-lb SUB IN TRIPIRATE*

STATE OF UTAH (L instructions on
reverse sule)

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 6· 'rass osa!ØNATION ANO 88RIAL NO.

Fee
6. 17 INDIAN, ALLOTTES OR TRIBE NAMESUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS --

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for auch proposals.)

L 7. UNIT AGaggMENT NAME
°w','em O °w^="to O 42... Gas Storage - Withdrawal/Injection Well --

2. NAME 07 OPERATOR 8. PARAt Om LBASE NAME

Wexpro Company Coalville Gas Storae
3. ADDERES 07 OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

P. O. Box 458, Rock Springs, WY 82902 12
4. r.OCATION or wmLL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirementa.• 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCATSee also space 17 below.)at surfac• Gas Storage

NW SE, 2170' FSL, 1449' FEL 11. aa T.,s..x..oaar.x.ano

9-2N--5E, SLB&M
14. PERMIT NO. 1ô. ELavATroNa (Show whether or, xT, an, eto.) 12. CooNor os FAarsa 18. sTArs

GR 5617' Summit Utah

te· CheckAppropnate BoxTo Indicate Natureof Notice,Report,or Other Data
NOTICS OP INTENTION TO: SUSSEQUENT EMPORT 07:

TEST WATER SHUT-Orr PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT•Orr REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REFAIR WELL CHANGE PLANs (Other) Supplemental History x

(Other) (NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel
('ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMI'LETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pert1-
nent to this work.) *
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Form OGCC-1 be
ST A TE OF UT A H SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE*

(Other instructions on re-
verse side) 5. LEASE DESIONATION AND SERIAL NO.

OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION
Fee

SUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRIBE NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or þlug back to a different reservoir. ¯¯

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

°w'.LLL WABLL O o,,,, Gas Storage - Withdrawal/Injection Well
2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

Wexpro Company .Coalville Gas Storage
8. Anomass or oran&Ton 9. WELL NO.

P. O. Box 458, Rock Springs, WY 829 17
4. LOCATION OF WELL Report location clearly and in accordance i ith any State requirements. 10. FIELD AND POOL, 08 WILDCAT

SAæsal o sepace 17 b )
11. BBC., 2., B., M., 6E BLE. AND

BURVET OR ARMA
NW SE, 2170' FSL, 1449' FEL DMSIONOF 9-2N-5E, SLB&M

14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whethe þ¾as.& &6;UNmta 12. co===r on ex==.« sa.. a=·

API: 43-043-30249 GR 5617' KB 5631.60' Summit Utah

1e• teck Appropriate BoxTo Indicate Nature of Notice,Report,or OtherData
NOTICE 07 INTENTION TO: BUBBBqUENT REPORT 07:

TEST WATER SHUTATP PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONNENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANs (Other) Supplemental History x
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel

(Other) ('ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)
17. DESCRIBE PROPÖSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this Work.) *

Depth 3060',,total depth reached 1-5-84.

Landed 13-3/8" OD, 54.5#, K-55, 8 rd thrd, ST&C casing at 510.60' KBM or 14.60' below
KB. The 13-3/8" OD casing flange is 1.00' above ground level. Circulated casing 1/4
hour prior to cementing. Cemented casing using 600 sacks Regular Type G cement treated
with 3% Calcium Chloride and 1/4# flocele per sack. Good returns throughout cementing
operations. Returned 75 barrels cement slurry to surface. Cement in place @ 6:00 P.M.
12-12-83.

Landed 94/8" OD, 36#, K-55, 8 rd thrd, ST&C casing at 1531.99' KBM or 14.60' below KB
in a 9-5/8" X 10" 3000 psi casing head which is at ground level. Cemented casing with

730 sacks Regular Type G cement treated with 2% CaCl and 1/4# nello-flakes. Good and
full returns for 89 barrels then lost returns until 98 barrels. Full returns for rest
of job. Displaced with 116.5 barrels 11.5 mud. Did not bump plug. Returned 44 barrels
slurry to surface with a pumping pressure of 500 psi. Cement fell to 24.90' KB and

held theres Plug down and cement in place @ 10:30 P.M., 12-23-83.

DST #1: TD 3060', Packers 2812' & 2862', coal zone, check for reservoir gas, IO 10 mins,

ISI 20 mins, FO 30 mins, FSI 60 mins, opened weak, declined to very weak in 7 mins,
reopened weak, dead in 11 mins, no gas to surface, recovered 30 ' mud, 11.4 ppg, Res 2.5%
@ 68°F, sample chamber 2000 cc mud 104 psig, 11.4 ppg, Res 2.5%, pit mud 11.5 ppg, Res

3.0%, IHP 1742, IOFP's 50-53, ISIP 1741, F0FP's 61-60, FSIP 1738, FHP 1740, BHT 89°F.

18. hµeb eertit a et rue and correct

TITLE Drilling Superintendent pay,
1-9-84

(This space for Federal or State ofBee use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructionson Reverse

Form OGCC-1 be
ST A TE OF UT A H SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE*

(Other instructions on re-
verse side) 5. LEASE DESIONATION AND SERIAL NO.

OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION
Fee

SUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRIBE NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or þlug back to a different reservoir. ¯¯

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

°w'.LLL WABLL O o,,,, Gas Storage - Withdrawal/Injection Well
2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

Wexpro Company .Coalville Gas Storage
8. Anomass or oran&Ton 9. WELL NO.

P. O. Box 458, Rock Springs, WY 829 17
4. LOCATION OF WELL Report location clearly and in accordance i ith any State requirements. 10. FIELD AND POOL, 08 WILDCAT
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11. BBC., 2., B., M., 6E BLE. AND

BURVET OR ARMA
NW SE, 2170' FSL, 1449' FEL DMSIONOF 9-2N-5E, SLB&M

14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whethe þ¾as.& &6;UNmta 12. co===r on ex==.« sa.. a=·

API: 43-043-30249 GR 5617' KB 5631.60' Summit Utah
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NOTICE 07 INTENTION TO: BUBBBqUENT REPORT 07:

TEST WATER SHUTATP PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL
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SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANs (Other) Supplemental History x
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel

(Other) ('ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)
17. DESCRIBE PROPÖSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this Work.) *

Depth 3060',,total depth reached 1-5-84.

Landed 13-3/8" OD, 54.5#, K-55, 8 rd thrd, ST&C casing at 510.60' KBM or 14.60' below
KB. The 13-3/8" OD casing flange is 1.00' above ground level. Circulated casing 1/4
hour prior to cementing. Cemented casing using 600 sacks Regular Type G cement treated
with 3% Calcium Chloride and 1/4# flocele per sack. Good returns throughout cementing
operations. Returned 75 barrels cement slurry to surface. Cement in place @ 6:00 P.M.
12-12-83.

Landed 94/8" OD, 36#, K-55, 8 rd thrd, ST&C casing at 1531.99' KBM or 14.60' below KB

in a 9-5/8" X 10" 3000 psi casing head which is at ground level. Cemented casing with

730 sacks Regular Type G cement treated with 2% CaCl and 1/4# nello-flakes. Good and
full returns for 89 barrels then lost returns until 98 barrels. Full returns for rest
of job. Displaced with 116.5 barrels 11.5 mud. Did not bump plug. Returned 44 barrels
slurry to surface with a pumping pressure of 500 psi. Cement fell to 24.90' KB and

held theres Plug down and cement in place @ 10:30 P.M., 12-23-83.

DST #1: TD 3060', Packers 2812' & 2862', coal zone, check for reservoir gas, IO 10 mins,

ISI 20 mins, FO 30 mins, FSI 60 mins, opened weak, declined to very weak in 7 mins,
reopened weak, dead in 11 mins, no gas to surface, recovered 30 ' mud, 11.4 ppg, Res 2.5%
@ 68°F, sample chamber 2000 cc mud 104 psig, 11.4 ppg, Res 2.5%, pit mud 11.5 ppg, Res

3.0%, IHP 1742, IOFP's 50-53, ISIP 1741, F0FP's 61-60, FSIP 1738, FHP 1740, BHT 89°F.
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1-9-84

(This space for Federal or State ofBee use)
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*See Instructionson Reverse
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ST A TE OF UT A H SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE*

(Other instructions on re-
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OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION
Fee

SUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRIBE NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or þlug back to a different reservoir. ¯¯

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

°w'.LLL WABLL O o,,,, Gas Storage - Withdrawal/Injection Well
2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

Wexpro Company .Coalville Gas Storage
8. Anomass or oran&Ton 9. WELL NO.

P. O. Box 458, Rock Springs, WY 829 17
4. LOCATION OF WELL Report location clearly and in accordance i ith any State requirements. 10. FIELD AND POOL, 08 WILDCAT
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11. BBC., 2., B., M., 6E BLE. AND
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NW SE, 2170' FSL, 1449' FEL DMSIONOF 9-2N-5E, SLB&M
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API: 43-043-30249 GR 5617' KB 5631.60' Summit Utah
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REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANs (Other) Supplemental History x
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel

(Other) ('ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)
17. DESCRIBE PROPÖSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this Work.) *

Depth 3060',,total depth reached 1-5-84.

Landed 13-3/8" OD, 54.5#, K-55, 8 rd thrd, ST&C casing at 510.60' KBM or 14.60' below
KB. The 13-3/8" OD casing flange is 1.00' above ground level. Circulated casing 1/4
hour prior to cementing. Cemented casing using 600 sacks Regular Type G cement treated
with 3% Calcium Chloride and 1/4# flocele per sack. Good returns throughout cementing
operations. Returned 75 barrels cement slurry to surface. Cement in place @ 6:00 P.M.
12-12-83.

Landed 94/8" OD, 36#, K-55, 8 rd thrd, ST&C casing at 1531.99' KBM or 14.60' below KB
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730 sacks Regular Type G cement treated with 2% CaCl and 1/4# nello-flakes. Good and
full returns for 89 barrels then lost returns until 98 barrels. Full returns for rest
of job. Displaced with 116.5 barrels 11.5 mud. Did not bump plug. Returned 44 barrels
slurry to surface with a pumping pressure of 500 psi. Cement fell to 24.90' KB and

held theres Plug down and cement in place @ 10:30 P.M., 12-23-83.

DST #1: TD 3060', Packers 2812' & 2862', coal zone, check for reservoir gas, IO 10 mins,

ISI 20 mins, FO 30 mins, FSI 60 mins, opened weak, declined to very weak in 7 mins,
reopened weak, dead in 11 mins, no gas to surface, recovered 30 ' mud, 11.4 ppg, Res 2.5%
@ 68°F, sample chamber 2000 cc mud 104 psig, 11.4 ppg, Res 2.5%, pit mud 11.5 ppg, Res

3.0%, IHP 1742, IOFP's 50-53, ISIP 1741, F0FP's 61-60, FSIP 1738, FHP 1740, BHT 89°F.
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nent to this Work.) *

Depth 3060',,total depth reached 1-5-84.

Landed 13-3/8" OD, 54.5#, K-55, 8 rd thrd, ST&C casing at 510.60' KBM or 14.60' below
KB. The 13-3/8" OD casing flange is 1.00' above ground level. Circulated casing 1/4
hour prior to cementing. Cemented casing using 600 sacks Regular Type G cement treated
with 3% Calcium Chloride and 1/4# flocele per sack. Good returns throughout cementing
operations. Returned 75 barrels cement slurry to surface. Cement in place @ 6:00 P.M.
12-12-83.

Landed 94/8" OD, 36#, K-55, 8 rd thrd, ST&C casing at 1531.99' KBM or 14.60' below KB

in a 9-5/8" X 10" 3000 psi casing head which is at ground level. Cemented casing with

730 sacks Regular Type G cement treated with 2% CaCl and 1/4# nello-flakes. Good and
full returns for 89 barrels then lost returns until 98 barrels. Full returns for rest
of job. Displaced with 116.5 barrels 11.5 mud. Did not bump plug. Returned 44 barrels
slurry to surface with a pumping pressure of 500 psi. Cement fell to 24.90' KB and

held theres Plug down and cement in place @ 10:30 P.M., 12-23-83.
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3.0%, IHP 1742, IOFP's 50-53, ISIP 1741, F0FP's 61-60, FSIP 1738, FHP 1740, BHT 89°F.

18. hµeb eertit a et rue and correct

TITLE Drilling Superintendent pay,
1-9-84

(This space for Federal or State ofBee use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructionson Reverse

Form OGCC-1 be
ST A TE OF UT A H SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE*

(Other instructions on re-
verse side) 5. LEASE DESIONATION AND SERIAL NO.

OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION
Fee

SUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRIBE NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or þlug back to a different reservoir. ¯¯

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

°w'.LLL WABLL O o,,,, Gas Storage - Withdrawal/Injection Well
2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

Wexpro Company .Coalville Gas Storage
8. Anomass or oran&Ton 9. WELL NO.

P. O. Box 458, Rock Springs, WY 829 17
4. LOCATION OF WELL Report location clearly and in accordance i ith any State requirements. 10. FIELD AND POOL, 08 WILDCAT

SAæsal o sepace 17 b )
11. BBC., 2., B., M., 6E BLE. AND

BURVET OR ARMA
NW SE, 2170' FSL, 1449' FEL DMSIONOF 9-2N-5E, SLB&M

14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whethe þ¾as.& &6;UNmta 12. co===r on ex==.« sa.. a=·

API: 43-043-30249 GR 5617' KB 5631.60' Summit Utah

1e• teck Appropriate BoxTo Indicate Nature of Notice,Report,or OtherData
NOTICE 07 INTENTION TO: BUBBBqUENT REPORT 07:

TEST WATER SHUTATP PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANs (Other) Supplemental History x
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel

(Other) ('ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)
17. DESCRIBE PROPÖSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this Work.) *

Depth 3060',,total depth reached 1-5-84.

Landed 13-3/8" OD, 54.5#, K-55, 8 rd thrd, ST&C casing at 510.60' KBM or 14.60' below
KB. The 13-3/8" OD casing flange is 1.00' above ground level. Circulated casing 1/4
hour prior to cementing. Cemented casing using 600 sacks Regular Type G cement treated
with 3% Calcium Chloride and 1/4# flocele per sack. Good returns throughout cementing
operations. Returned 75 barrels cement slurry to surface. Cement in place @ 6:00 P.M.
12-12-83.

Landed 94/8" OD, 36#, K-55, 8 rd thrd, ST&C casing at 1531.99' KBM or 14.60' below KB

in a 9-5/8" X 10" 3000 psi casing head which is at ground level. Cemented casing with

730 sacks Regular Type G cement treated with 2% CaCl and 1/4# nello-flakes. Good and
full returns for 89 barrels then lost returns until 98 barrels. Full returns for rest
of job. Displaced with 116.5 barrels 11.5 mud. Did not bump plug. Returned 44 barrels
slurry to surface with a pumping pressure of 500 psi. Cement fell to 24.90' KB and

held theres Plug down and cement in place @ 10:30 P.M., 12-23-83.

DST #1: TD 3060', Packers 2812' & 2862', coal zone, check for reservoir gas, IO 10 mins,

ISI 20 mins, FO 30 mins, FSI 60 mins, opened weak, declined to very weak in 7 mins,
reopened weak, dead in 11 mins, no gas to surface, recovered 30 ' mud, 11.4 ppg, Res 2.5%
@ 68°F, sample chamber 2000 cc mud 104 psig, 11.4 ppg, Res 2.5%, pit mud 11.5 ppg, Res

3.0%, IHP 1742, IOFP's 50-53, ISIP 1741, F0FP's 61-60, FSIP 1738, FHP 1740, BHT 89°F.

18. hµeb eertit a et rue and correct

TITLE Drilling Superintendent pay,
1-9-84

(This space for Federal or State ofBee use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructionson Reverse



Form OGC-3 SUBMIT IN DUPL1 E
STATE OF UTAH (Seeotherinstructiom 56 64 01

on reverse side)
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION LND BERIAL NO

Fee

WELL COMPLETIONOR RECOMPLETION REPORTAND LOG *
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRIBE NAME

la. TYPE OF WELL: o sLL
DaY O e OSS TRŸg O EEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF COMPLETION: Withdrawal/Injection
EL

OWOEnRK EP O O "'Ist.O Other 8. FARH OR LEASE NAME

2. NAME OF OPERATOR S Storage
Wexpro Company ELI. N

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR

P. O. Box 458, Rock Springs, WY 82902 FIEI.D AND POOL, OR ILDCAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance softh an tage )
At surface NW SE, 2170' FSL, 1449' FEL e cK NDSURVEY

At top prod. Interval reported below D 810NOF 2 s BH
At total depth

43-043-30249 10-22-83 ÎtÄh
15. DATE SPUDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 1Î. DATE COMPL. (ÑØSdg $0 pf0d.) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, REB T, GB, T e 1 ELEV SINGREAD

12-10-83 1-9-84 1-26-84 KB 563&i60' 561
20. TorAL DEFTH, MD & TTD 21. PLUG, BACK T.D., MD A TVD 22. IF Hur.TIPLE coxPI 23. INTsavar.s aoTAar TooLs CABLE TooLB

HOW MANT* DRILLED BI

3060 3000 -- 0 O' 6
24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION-TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND TTD $2 WAS DIRECTIONAL

- BURVET MADE

2890'-2900' - Frontier No
26. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN 27. AS WELL CORED

RIIC<$onic-GIb, a dipm t
CASING REC et in well)

CASINO SIZE EIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTH SET (MD) ROLE 8 CEMENTING RECORD MOUNT PULLED

L3-3 8 511 17-1/2 01.
6 153 730+ox Reg G4cmt w/2% CaC Of

7.0 3048 8-3/4 300 sx 50-50 Pozmix w/2% - -0:

CaC1 & 3DO sž31icnit
29 LINER RECORD 30. , STUBING RECORD 3 g ¿ )

arz TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT* SCREEN MD) 81EE -
, ÈE ( ) PACK B BET (MD)

3-1/2 2813 2806

1. PERFORATION RECORD (Interval, size and Rum cr) 82. ACID, SHOT. FRACTURE. CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH TAL (MD) ÄMOUN AND KIND OP 3tÀTERIAL USED

2890 '-2900'

83. PRODUCTI(N g
DATE FIRST-PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD OWing, pse Êíff, pumping-ti G¾d igpg Of pgap) ELCBTATUS (PTO N¢ing Or

shut-ing g c

N/ A Shut in
DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SIZE PROD'N. FOR OHr--BÉL. ' CAS-McF. ATER---BBI. AB-OII. RATIO

TEST PERIOD

FLOW. TURING 75-58. CASINO PRESSURE CALCULATED OHr--BBL. CAS-MCF. _ WATER-BBL.
. OIL GRAVITT-APL (COBB.)

24-Hous RAT

34. DISPOSITION Or oAa (Bold, used for fuel, vented, etc.) TsaT WITNaasso BT

35. LIST OF ATTACHMENTS

30. I hereby certify the foregoing and at ched information is complete and correct ao determined from,all available recorde

ammm ////I rrrra Director, Petroleum ES.
*(S Instructionsand Spacesfor Additional Data on Reverse

Form OGC-3 SUBMIT IN DUPL1 E
STATE OF UTAH (Seeotherinstructiom 56 64 01

on reverse side)
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION LND BERIAL NO

Fee

WELL COMPLETIONOR RECOMPLETION REPORTAND LOG *
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRIBE NAME

la. TYPE OF WELL: o sLL
DaY O e OSS TRŸg O EEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF COMPLETION: Withdrawal/Injection
EL

OWOEnRK EP O O "'Ist.O Other 8. FARH OR LEASE NAME

2. NAME OF OPERATOR S Storage
Wexpro Company ELI. N

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR

P. O. Box 458, Rock Springs, WY 82902 FIEI.D AND POOL, OR ILDCAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance softh an tage )
At surface NW SE, 2170' FSL, 1449' FEL e cK NDSURVEY

At top prod. Interval reported below D 810NOF 2 s BH
At total depth

43-043-30249 10-22-83 ÎtÄh
15. DATE SPUDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 1Î. DATE COMPL. (ÑØSdg $0 pf0d.) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, REB T, GB, T e 1 ELEV SINGREAD

12-10-83 1-9-84 1-26-84 KB 563&i60' 561
20. TorAL DEFTH, MD & TTD 21. PLUG, BACK T.D., MD A TVD 22. IF Hur.TIPLE coxPI 23. INTsavar.s aoTAar TooLs CABLE TooLB

HOW MANT* DRILLED BI

3060 3000 -- 0 O' 6
24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION-TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND TTD $2 WAS DIRECTIONAL

- BURVET MADE

2890'-2900' - Frontier No
26. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN 27. AS WELL CORED

RIIC<$onic-GIb, a dipm t
CASING REC et in well)

CASINO SIZE EIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTH SET (MD) ROLE 8 CEMENTING RECORD MOUNT PULLED

L3-3 8 511 17-1/2 01.
6 153 730+ox Reg G4cmt w/2% CaC Of

7.0 3048 8-3/4 300 sx 50-50 Pozmix w/2% - -0:

CaC1 & 3DO sž31icnit
29 LINER RECORD 30. , STUBING RECORD 3 g ¿ )

arz TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT* SCREEN MD) 81EE -
, ÈE ( ) PACK B BET (MD)

3-1/2 2813 2806

1. PERFORATION RECORD (Interval, size and Rum cr) 82. ACID, SHOT. FRACTURE. CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH TAL (MD) ÄMOUN AND KIND OP 3tÀTERIAL USED

2890 '-2900'

83. PRODUCTI(N g
DATE FIRST-PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD OWing, pse Êíff, pumping-ti G¾d igpg Of pgap) ELCBTATUS (PTO N¢ing Or

shut-ing g c

N/ A Shut in
DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SIZE PROD'N. FOR OHr--BÉL. ' CAS-McF. ATER---BBI. AB-OII. RATIO

TEST PERIOD

FLOW. TURING 75-58. CASINO PRESSURE CALCULATED OHr--BBL. CAS-MCF. _ WATER-BBL.
. OIL GRAVITT-APL (COBB.)

24-Hous RAT

34. DISPOSITION Or oAa (Bold, used for fuel, vented, etc.) TsaT WITNaasso BT

35. LIST OF ATTACHMENTS

30. I hereby certify the foregoing and at ched information is complete and correct ao determined from,all available recorde

ammm ////I rrrra Director, Petroleum ES.
*(S Instructionsand Spacesfor Additional Data on Reverse

Form OGC-3 SUBMIT IN DUPL1 E
STATE OF UTAH (Seeotherinstructiom 56 64 01

on reverse side)
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION LND BERIAL NO

Fee

WELL COMPLETIONOR RECOMPLETION REPORTAND LOG *
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRIBE NAME

la. TYPE OF WELL: o sLL
DaY O e OSS TRŸg O EEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF COMPLETION: Withdrawal/Injection
EL

OWOEnRK EP O O "'Ist.O Other 8. FARH OR LEASE NAME

2. NAME OF OPERATOR S Storage
Wexpro Company ELI. N

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR

P. O. Box 458, Rock Springs, WY 82902 FIEI.D AND POOL, OR ILDCAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance softh an tage )
At surface NW SE, 2170' FSL, 1449' FEL e cK NDSURVEY

At top prod. Interval reported below D 810NOF 2 s BH
At total depth

43-043-30249 10-22-83 ÎtÄh
15. DATE SPUDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 1Î. DATE COMPL. (ÑØSdg $0 pf0d.) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, REB T, GB, T e 1 ELEV SINGREAD

12-10-83 1-9-84 1-26-84 KB 563&i60' 561
20. TorAL DEFTH, MD & TTD 21. PLUG, BACK T.D., MD A TVD 22. IF Hur.TIPLE coxPI 23. INTsavar.s aoTAar TooLs CABLE TooLB

HOW MANT* DRILLED BI

3060 3000 -- 0 O' 6
24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION-TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND TTD $2 WAS DIRECTIONAL

- BURVET MADE

2890'-2900' - Frontier No
26. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN 27. AS WELL CORED

RIIC<$onic-GIb, a dipm t
CASING REC et in well)

CASINO SIZE EIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTH SET (MD) ROLE 8 CEMENTING RECORD MOUNT PULLED

L3-3 8 511 17-1/2 01.
6 153 730+ox Reg G4cmt w/2% CaC Of

7.0 3048 8-3/4 300 sx 50-50 Pozmix w/2% - -0:

CaC1 & 3DO sž31icnit
29 LINER RECORD 30. , STUBING RECORD 3 g ¿ )

arz TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT* SCREEN MD) 81EE -
, ÈE ( ) PACK B BET (MD)

3-1/2 2813 2806

1. PERFORATION RECORD (Interval, size and Rum cr) 82. ACID, SHOT. FRACTURE. CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH TAL (MD) ÄMOUN AND KIND OP 3tÀTERIAL USED

2890 '-2900'

83. PRODUCTI(N g
DATE FIRST-PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD OWing, pse Êíff, pumping-ti G¾d igpg Of pgap) ELCBTATUS (PTO N¢ing Or

shut-ing g c

N/ A Shut in
DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SIZE PROD'N. FOR OHr--BÉL. ' CAS-McF. ATER---BBI. AB-OII. RATIO

TEST PERIOD

FLOW. TURING 75-58. CASINO PRESSURE CALCULATED OHr--BBL. CAS-MCF. _ WATER-BBL.
. OIL GRAVITT-APL (COBB.)

24-Hous RAT

34. DISPOSITION Or oAa (Bold, used for fuel, vented, etc.) TsaT WITNaasso BT

35. LIST OF ATTACHMENTS

30. I hereby certify the foregoing and at ched information is complete and correct ao determined from,all available recorde

ammm ////I rrrra Director, Petroleum ES.
*(S Instructionsand Spacesfor Additional Data on Reverse

Form OGC-3 SUBMIT IN DUPL1 E
STATE OF UTAH (Seeotherinstructiom 56 64 01

on reverse side)
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION LND BERIAL NO

Fee

WELL COMPLETIONOR RECOMPLETION REPORTAND LOG *
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRIBE NAME

la. TYPE OF WELL: o sLL
DaY O e OSS TRŸg O EEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF COMPLETION: Withdrawal/Injection
EL

OWOEnRK EP O O "'Ist.O Other 8. FARH OR LEASE NAME

2. NAME OF OPERATOR S Storage
Wexpro Company ELI. N

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR

P. O. Box 458, Rock Springs, WY 82902 FIEI.D AND POOL, OR ILDCAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance softh an tage )
At surface NW SE, 2170' FSL, 1449' FEL e cK NDSURVEY

At top prod. Interval reported below D 810NOF 2 s BH
At total depth

43-043-30249 10-22-83 ÎtÄh
15. DATE SPUDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 1Î. DATE COMPL. (ÑØSdg $0 pf0d.) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, REB T, GB, T e 1 ELEV SINGREAD

12-10-83 1-9-84 1-26-84 KB 563&i60' 561
20. TorAL DEFTH, MD & TTD 21. PLUG, BACK T.D., MD A TVD 22. IF Hur.TIPLE coxPI 23. INTsavar.s aoTAar TooLs CABLE TooLB

HOW MANT* DRILLED BI

3060 3000 -- 0 O' 6
24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION-TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND TTD $2 WAS DIRECTIONAL

- BURVET MADE

2890'-2900' - Frontier No
26. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN 27. AS WELL CORED

RIIC<$onic-GIb, a dipm t
CASING REC et in well)

CASINO SIZE EIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTH SET (MD) ROLE 8 CEMENTING RECORD MOUNT PULLED

L3-3 8 511 17-1/2 01.
6 153 730+ox Reg G4cmt w/2% CaC Of

7.0 3048 8-3/4 300 sx 50-50 Pozmix w/2% - -0:

CaC1 & 3DO sž31icnit
29 LINER RECORD 30. , STUBING RECORD 3 g ¿ )

arz TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT* SCREEN MD) 81EE -
, ÈE ( ) PACK B BET (MD)

3-1/2 2813 2806

1. PERFORATION RECORD (Interval, size and Rum cr) 82. ACID, SHOT. FRACTURE. CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH TAL (MD) ÄMOUN AND KIND OP 3tÀTERIAL USED

2890 '-2900'

83. PRODUCTI(N g
DATE FIRST-PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD OWing, pse Êíff, pumping-ti G¾d igpg Of pgap) ELCBTATUS (PTO N¢ing Or

shut-ing g c

N/ A Shut in
DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SIZE PROD'N. FOR OHr--BÉL. ' CAS-McF. ATER---BBI. AB-OII. RATIO

TEST PERIOD

FLOW. TURING 75-58. CASINO PRESSURE CALCULATED OHr--BBL. CAS-MCF. _ WATER-BBL.
. OIL GRAVITT-APL (COBB.)

24-Hous RAT

34. DISPOSITION Or oAa (Bold, used for fuel, vented, etc.) TsaT WITNaasso BT

35. LIST OF ATTACHMENTS

30. I hereby certify the foregoing and at ched information is complete and correct ao determined from,all available recorde

ammm ////I rrrra Director, Petroleum ES.
*(S Instructionsand Spacesfor Additional Data on Reverse

Form OGC-3 SUBMIT IN DUPL1 E
STATE OF UTAH (Seeotherinstructiom 56 64 01

on reverse side)
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION LND BERIAL NO

Fee

WELL COMPLETIONOR RECOMPLETION REPORTAND LOG *
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRIBE NAME

la. TYPE OF WELL: o sLL
DaY O e OSS TRŸg O EEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF COMPLETION: Withdrawal/Injection
EL

OWOEnRK EP O O "'Ist.O Other 8. FARH OR LEASE NAME

2. NAME OF OPERATOR S Storage
Wexpro Company ELI. N

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR

P. O. Box 458, Rock Springs, WY 82902 FIEI.D AND POOL, OR ILDCAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance softh an tage )
At surface NW SE, 2170' FSL, 1449' FEL e cK NDSURVEY

At top prod. Interval reported below D 810NOF 2 s BH
At total depth

43-043-30249 10-22-83 ÎtÄh
15. DATE SPUDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 1Î. DATE COMPL. (ÑØSdg $0 pf0d.) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, REB T, GB, T e 1 ELEV SINGREAD

12-10-83 1-9-84 1-26-84 KB 563&i60' 561
20. TorAL DEFTH, MD & TTD 21. PLUG, BACK T.D., MD A TVD 22. IF Hur.TIPLE coxPI 23. INTsavar.s aoTAar TooLs CABLE TooLB

HOW MANT* DRILLED BI

3060 3000 -- 0 O' 6
24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION-TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND TTD $2 WAS DIRECTIONAL

- BURVET MADE

2890'-2900' - Frontier No
26. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN 27. AS WELL CORED

RIIC<$onic-GIb, a dipm t
CASING REC et in well)

CASINO SIZE EIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTH SET (MD) ROLE 8 CEMENTING RECORD MOUNT PULLED

L3-3 8 511 17-1/2 01.
6 153 730+ox Reg G4cmt w/2% CaC Of

7.0 3048 8-3/4 300 sx 50-50 Pozmix w/2% - -0:

CaC1 & 3DO sž31icnit
29 LINER RECORD 30. , STUBING RECORD 3 g ¿ )

arz TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT* SCREEN MD) 81EE -
, ÈE ( ) PACK B BET (MD)

3-1/2 2813 2806

1. PERFORATION RECORD (Interval, size and Rum cr) 82. ACID, SHOT. FRACTURE. CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH TAL (MD) ÄMOUN AND KIND OP 3tÀTERIAL USED

2890 '-2900'

83. PRODUCTI(N g
DATE FIRST-PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD OWing, pse Êíff, pumping-ti G¾d igpg Of pgap) ELCBTATUS (PTO N¢ing Or

shut-ing g c

N/ A Shut in
DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SIZE PROD'N. FOR OHr--BÉL. ' CAS-McF. ATER---BBI. AB-OII. RATIO

TEST PERIOD

FLOW. TURING 75-58. CASINO PRESSURE CALCULATED OHr--BBL. CAS-MCF. _ WATER-BBL.
. OIL GRAVITT-APL (COBB.)

24-Hous RAT

34. DISPOSITION Or oAa (Bold, used for fuel, vented, etc.) TsaT WITNaasso BT

35. LIST OF ATTACHMENTS

30. I hereby certify the foregoing and at ched information is complete and correct ao determined from,all available recorde

ammm ////I rrrra Director, Petroleum ES.
*(S Instructionsand Spacesfor Additional Data on Reverse
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'
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

Fee
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° Coalville Gas Stor edrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Gas Storage/Inject. Withdrawal 8. WELLNAMEandNUMBER:

Coalville 12
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Questar Pipeline Company 4304330249
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

P.O. Box 45360 CRY SLC sy,,, UT ,,,84145-0360 (801) 324-5555 Coalville Gas Storage
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1449' FEL, 2170' FSL COUNTY: Sumit

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NE SE 9 2N 5E SLM STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Name Chanqe
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Purpose is to inform of the change in name on the subject leases from Metzteirt·Fuel·Gupply·Gempany-to Questar Pipeline
Company. Wexpro Company

Effective

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) R. J. Zobell EnglA TITLE Manager, Engineering & Project Management

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
JAN13 2004

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

ply.OFOIL,GAS&

'
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

ROUTINGOPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH
2. CDW
3. FILE

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent/Operator

X Operator Name Change Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 3/7/1988
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N1070-Wexpro Company N7560-QuestarPipeline Company

PO Box 45360 PO Box 11450
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0360 Salt Lake City, UT 84147

Phone: 1-(801) 534-5267 Phone: 1-(801) 530-2019
CA No. Unit:

WELL(S)
NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL

NO TYPE TYPE STATUSCOALVILLE GAS STORAGE 8 10 020N 050E 4304330192 99990 Fee GS ACOALVILLE GAS STORAGE 9 10 020N 050E 4304330193 99990 Fee GS ACOALVILLE GAS STORAGE 10 10 020N 050E 4304330244 99990 Fee GS ACOALVILLE GAS STORAGE 12 09 020N 050E 4304330249 99990 Fee GS ACLAY BASIN UNIT 5 20 030N 240E 4300915629 1025 Fee GS A

CLAY BASIN UNIT 3 16 030N 240E 4300915627 1025 State GS ACLAY BASIN UNIT 27-S 16 030N 240E 4300930018 1025 State GS ACLAY BASIN UNIT 52-S 16 030N 240E 4300930048 1025 State GS ACLAY BASIN UNIT 53-S 16 030N 240E 4300930049 1025 State GS ACLAY BASIN UNIT 59-S 16 030N 240E 4300930055 1025 State GS A

CLAY BASIN UNIT 35-S 17 030N 240E 4300930026 1025 Federal GS ACLAY BASIN UNIT 40-S 20 030N 240E 4300930031 1025 Federal GS ACLAY BASIN UNIT 49-S 20 030N 240E 4300930045 1025 Federal GS ACLAY BASIN UNIT 2 21 030N 240E 4300915626 1025 Federal GS ACLAY BASIN 24-S 21 030N 240E 4300930015 1025 Federal GS A
CLAY BASIN UNIT 25-S 2l 030N 240E 4300930016 1025 Federal GS ACLAY BASIN UNIT 26-S 21 030N 240E 4300930017 1025 Federal GS A
CLAY BASIN 30-S 21 030N 240E 4300930019 1025 Federal GS ACLAY BASIN UNIT 33-S 21 030N 240E 4300930024 1025 Federal GS A

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENT'ATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
I. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 1/13/2004

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 1/13/2004

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 1/14/2004

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 649172-0142

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

Wexpro Co 1 FORM

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

ROUTINGOPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH
2. CDW
3. FILE

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent/Operator

X Operator Name Change Merger
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Wexpro Co 1 FORM



6. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: 3/9/1989

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: n/a

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC" The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,
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LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
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Wexpro Co 1 FORM
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NEW ENTITY NUMBERS ASSIGNED FEBRUARY 2004

ACCT OPERATOR NAME API NUM. Sec Twnshp Rng WELL NAME ENTITY EFF DATE REASON

N7560 QuestarPipeline Co 4304310691 09 020N 050E Coalville Gas Storage 1 99990 to 14038 2/10/2004 Coalville Gas Storage

N7560 QuestarPipeline Co 4304330005 10 020N 050E Coalville Gas Storage 2 99990 to 14038 2/10/2004 Coalville Gas Storage

N7560 QuestarPipeline Co 4304330007 10 020N 050E Coalville Gas Storage 3 99990 to 14038 2/10/2004 Coalville Gas Storage

N7560 QuestarPipeline Co 4304330009 10 020N 050E Coalville Gas Storage 4 99990 to 14038 2/10/2004 Coalville Gas Storage

N7560 QuestarPipeline Co 4304330011 10 020N 050E Coalville Gas Storage 5 99990 to 14038 2/10/2004 Coalville Gas Storage

N7560 QuestarPipeline Co 4304330020 10 020N 050E Coalville Gas Storage 6 99990 to 14038 2/10/2004 Coalville Gas Storage

N7560 QuestarPipeline Co 4304330021 10 020N 050E Coalville Gas Storage 7 99990 to 14038 2/10/2004 Coalville Gas Storage

N7560 QuestarPipeline Co 4304330192 10 020N 050E Coalville Gas Storage 8 99990 to 14038 2/10/2004 Coalville Gas Storage

N7560 QuestarPipeline Co 4304330193 10 020N 050E Coalville Gas Storage 9 99990 to 14038 2/10/2004 Coalville Gas Storage

N7560 QuestarPipeline Co 4304330244 10 020N 050E Coalville Gas Storage 10 99990 to 14038 2/10/2004 Coalville Gas Storage

N7560 QuestarPipeline Co 4304330249 09 020N 050E Coalville Gas Storage 12 99990 to 14038 2/10/2004 Coalville Gas Storage

Note to file: These entity numbers
were changed to compliment the
operator correction from 3/7/98
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RECEIVED: Mar. 17, 2016

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Storage Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 COALVILLE GAS STORAGE 12 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QUESTAR PIPELINE COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43043302490000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 P.O.Box 45360 , Salt Lake city , UT, 84145 801 324-5061  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 COALVILLE GAS STORAGE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2170 FSL 1449 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 09 Township: 02.0N Range: 05.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 SUMMIT 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

5 /15 /2016

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Questar Pipeline Company is filing this Notice of Intent to
Plug and Abandon Coalville 12. Attached is the proposed
plugging procedure as well as the current and proposed

wellbore diagrams. The location will be reclaimed at a later
date. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Chris B. Balling 801 324-3619

TITLE
 Property Agent - ROW

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 3 /17 /2016

March 23, 2016

Sundry Number: 70541 API Well Number: 43043302490000Sundry Number: 70541 API Well Number: 43043302490000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Storage Well COALVILLEGAS STORAGE 12

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR PIPELINECOMPANY 43043302490000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O.Box 45360 , Salt Lake city , UT, 84145 801 324-5061 Ext COALVILLEGAS STORAGE

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SUMMIT

2170 FSL 1449 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWSE Section: 09 Township: 02.0N Range: 05.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

5/15/2016
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Pipeline Company is filing this Notice of Intent to Approved by the
Plug and Abandon Coalville 12. Attached is the proposed utah Division of
plugging procedure as well as the current and proposed Oil, Gas and Mining

wellbore diagrams. The location will be reclaimed at a later Date: March 23, 2016
date.

PleaseRoiewAtladiedCuditiusofAppron\

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Chris B. Balling 801 324-3619 Property Agent - ROW

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 3/17/2016

RECEIVED: Mar. 17,

Sundry Number: 70541 API Well Number: 43043302490000
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TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT
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5/15/2016
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plugging procedure as well as the current and proposed Oil, Gas and Mining

wellbore diagrams. The location will be reclaimed at a later Date: March 23, 2016
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NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Chris B. Balling 801 324-3619 Property Agent - ROW
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N/A 3/17/2016

RECEIVED: Mar. 17,
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STATE OF UTAH
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2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
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P.O.Box 45360 , Salt Lake city , UT, 84145 801 324-5061 Ext COALVILLEGAS STORAGE
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TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

5/15/2016
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:
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TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Pipeline Company is filing this Notice of Intent to Approved by the
Plug and Abandon Coalville 12. Attached is the proposed utah Division of
plugging procedure as well as the current and proposed Oil, Gas and Mining

wellbore diagrams. The location will be reclaimed at a later Date: March 23, 2016
date.

PleaseRoiewAtladiedCuditiusofAppron\

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Chris B. Balling 801 324-3619 Property Agent - ROW

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 3/17/2016

RECEIVED: Mar. 17,

Sundry Number: 70541 API Well Number: 43043302490000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Storage Well COALVILLEGAS STORAGE 12

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR PIPELINECOMPANY 43043302490000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O.Box 45360 , Salt Lake city , UT, 84145 801 324-5061 Ext COALVILLEGAS STORAGE

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SUMMIT

2170 FSL 1449 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWSE Section: 09 Township: 02.0N Range: 05.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

5/15/2016
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Pipeline Company is filing this Notice of Intent to Approved by the
Plug and Abandon Coalville 12. Attached is the proposed utah Division of
plugging procedure as well as the current and proposed Oil, Gas and Mining

wellbore diagrams. The location will be reclaimed at a later Date: March 23, 2016
date.

PleaseRoiewAtladiedCuditiusofAppron\

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Chris B. Balling 801 324-3619 Property Agent - ROW

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 3/17/2016

RECEIVED: Mar. 17,



RECEIVED: Mar. 23, 2016

  

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43043302490000

1. Notify the Division at least 24 hours prior to conducting abandonment operations. Please call
Dan Jarvis at 801-538-5338. 

2. Add Plug #3: A 25 sk (125’) cement plug shall be balanced from 525’ to 400’ to isolate the
surface shoe and fresh water from over pressured salt water sands. 

3. All balanced plugs shall be tagged to ensure they are at the depths specified in the procedure. 

4. All annuli shall be cemented from a minimum depth of 100’ to the surface. 

5. Surface reclamation shall be done in accordance with R649-3-34 – Well Site Restoration. 

6. All requirements in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-24 shall apply. 

7. If there are any changes to the procedure or the wellbore configuration, notify Dustin Doucet
at 801-538-5281 (ofc) or 801-733-0983 (home) prior to continuing with the procedure. 

8. All other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules
shall apply. 

Sundry Number: 70541 API Well Number: 43043302490000Sundry Number: 70541 API Well Number: 43043302490000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices
TI, BAS Pr NINTfdG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43043302490000

1. Notify the Division at least 24 hours prior to conducting abandonment operations. Please call
Dan Jarvis at 801-538-5338.

2. Add Plug #3: A 25 sk (125') cement plug shall be balanced from 525' to 400' to isolate the
surface shoe and fresh water from over pressured salt water sands.

3. AII balanced plugs shall be tagged to ensure they are at the depths specified in the procedure.

4. AII annuli shall be cemented from a minimum depth of 100' to the surface.

5. Surface reclamation shall be done in accordance with R649-3-34 - Well Site Restoration.

6. AII requirements in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-24 shall apply.

7. If there are any changes to the procedure or the wellbore configuration, notify Dustin Doucet
at 801-538-5281 (ofc) or 801-733-0983 (home) prior to continuing with the procedure.

8. AII other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules
shall apply.

RECEIVED: Mar. 23,
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8. AII other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules
shall apply.

RECEIVED: Mar. 23,



RECEIVED: Mar. 23, 2016

Sundry Number: 70541 API Well Number: 43043302490000Sundry Number: 70541 API Well Number: 43043302490000
3/23/2016 Wellbore Diagram r263

API Well No: 43-043-30249-00-00 Permit No: Well Name/No: COALVILLE GAS STORAGE 12

Company Name: QUESTAR PIPELINE COMPANY

Location: See: 9 T: 2N R: 5E Spot: NWSE String Information

Coordinates: X: 467725 Y: 4529988 Bottom Diameter Weight Length
String (ft sub) (inches) (Ib/ft) (ft)

Field Name: COALVILLE GAS STORAGE
HOLI 510 17.5

County Name: SUMMIT SURF 510 13.325 54.5
HOL2

5 36
HOL3 3060 8.75
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urface: 13.325 in. @510 ft

5

IIole: 17.5 i
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Hole: Ugknown

, Hole: 8.75 in. @3060 ft.

T I: 3060 TVD: PBTD:
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RECEIVED: Mar. 17, 2016

 

Questar Pipeline Company 
333 South State Street 
P.O. Box 45360 
Salt Lake City, UT 84145 
Tel (801) 324-3160 
Fax (801) 324-5606 

 

Coalville Gas Storage 12 
API 43-043-30249 

Plugging Procedure 

1. Test / install dead men anchors. 
2. MIRU slickline. Set FB tank and run line to same f/ WH for tubing bleed off. RIH w/ 2.80’’ GR to 

locate the Otis “X” nipple w/ 2.75’’ ID @ ~2823’. POOH and MU 2.75’’ blanking plug. RIH and 
set plug in bottom “X” nipple (~ 2830’) POOH. Hang back slickline. HU and bleed off tubing to 
FB tank to ensure plug set. RD slickline. 

3. MIRU a contract workover rig w/ pipe racks, mud pump, rig tank, and 1 – 400 bbl upright. Fill the 
upright with fresh water. Move in and set one 200 bbl cement returns tank. Lay return lines from 
flow back and rig tank to the wellhead. Bleed off any remaining well pressures. 

4. HU, fill tubing and casing annulus with fresh water taking note of volumes to fill. With annulus 
open to tank pressure test tubing and blanking plug to 1500#. Bleed off pressure f/ tubing. 

5. RU wireline contractor to perforate the 3-1/2’’ tubing in the bottom joint above the “Otis Seal 
assy” with 6 shots (¼’’ EH). POOH w/ WL. HU to tubing and establish circulation down tubing 
taking returns up casing annulus. Tubing vol. ~ 24 bbl. Casing annulus vol. ~80 bbls. RD WL after 
circulation has been established. Note: Annulus fluid may be a petroleum base fluid.  

6. ND production tree and NU 7-1/16”, 5M hydraulically operated double gate BOP with stripper 
head equipped w/ 3-1/2” pipe rams in the top gate and blind rams in the bottom gate. Function-
test both the blind and pipe rams. Hook up pump line to BOPE. 

7. Install pup into hanger & PU and un-land tubing and sting out of packer w/ seal assy. 
8. Break out and LD hanger, 1 jt of Seal Lock tubing and 2 tubing pups. 
9. POOH SB 46 stands of 3-1/2’’ EUE 8rd tubing. LD bottom single perforated jt and the Otis seal 

assy. Keep hole full for pipe displacement during trip out. 
10. If returns were clean during circulation. NU a 7-1/16’’ x 3-1/2’’ EUE 8rd companion flange to top 

of BOP. RU slickline and RIH and retrieve the blanking plug from lower “X” nipple. RD slickline.  
11. MIRU WL contractor with pressure control and lubricator. NU 7-1/16’’ WL flange. RIH w/ 6.00’’ 

GR/JB. Locate top of Otis permanent packer @ ~2806’. POOH, LD GR/JB. MU WL set CICR for 
7’’ 23# casing. RIH and set CICR ~ 5’ above Baker permanent packer top (~ 2,801’). Bleed off 
pressure from casing while POOH. RD WL.  

12. MU slick cement stinger w/ XO’s for CICR. Note: Will need 1 joint of replacement tubing to 
replace perforated joint. (transfer from Coalville #9)  

13. TIH to near top of CICR ~ 2,790’. HU and circulate hole volume w/ fresh water. Pressure test 
casing and CICR to 1500 psi to ensure integrity. MU tubing spacing pups w/ safety valve and 
tubing swivel. Close safety valve and sting into CICR. Re-test annulus to 500# to ensure CICR seal.  

14. Open safety valve on tubing to pump line. Establish injection rate thru CICR. Monitor annulus 
pressure during injection test.  

Sundry Number: 70541 API Well Number: 43043302490000Sundry Number: 70541 API Well Number: 43043302490000

ONESE N -

- - Questar Pipeline Company
333 South State Street
P.O. Box 45360
Salt Lake City, UT 84145
Tel (801) 324-3160
Fax (801) 324-5606

Coalville Gas Storage 12
API 43-043-30249

Plugging Procedure

1. Test / install dead men anchors.
2. MIRUslickline. Set FB tank and run line to same f/ WH for tubing bleed off. RIHw/ 2.80" GR to

locate the Otis "X" nipple w/ 2.75" ID @ ~2823'. POOH and MU 2.75" blanking plug. RIHand
set plug in bottom "X" nipple (~ 2830') POOH. Hang back slickline. HU and bleed off tubing to
FBtank to ensure plug set. RD slickline.

3. MIRU a contract workover rig w/ pipe racks, mud pump, rig tank, and 1 - 400 bbl upright. Fill the
upright with fresh water. Move in and set one 200 bbl cement returns tank. Lay return lines from
flow back and rig tank to the wellhead. Bleed off any remaining well pressures.

4. HU, fill tubing and casing annulus with fresh water taking note of volumes to fill. With annulus
open to tank pressure test tubing and blanking plug to 1500#. Bleed off pressure f/ tubing.

5. RU wireline contractor to perforate the 3-1/2" tubing in the bottom joint above the "Otis Seal
assy" with 6 shots (¼" EH). POOH w/ WL. HU to tubing and establish circulation down tubing
taking returns up casing annulus. Tubing vol. ~ 24 bbl. Casing annulus vol. ~80 bbls. RDWL after
circulation has been established. Note: Annulus fluid may be a petroleum base fluid.

6. ND production tree and NU 7-1/16", 5M hydraulically operated double gate BOP with stripper
head equipped w/ 3-1/2" pipe rams in the top gate and blind rams in the bottom gate. Function-
test both the blind and pipe rams. Hook up pump line to BOPE.

7. Install pup into hanger & PU and un-land tubing and sting out of packer w/ seal assy.
8. Break out and LDhanger, 1 jt of Seal Lock tubing and 2 tubing pups.
9. POOH SB 46 stands of 3-1/2" EUE8rd tubing. LDbottom single perforated jt and the Otis seal

assy. Keep hole full for pipe displacement during trip out.
10. If returns were clean during circulation. NU a 7-1/16" x 3-1/2" EUE8rd companion flange to top

of BOP. RU slickline and RIHand retrieve the blanking plug from lower "X" nipple. RD slickline.
11. MIRUWL contractor with pressure control and lubricator. NU 7-1/16" WL flange. RIHw/ 6.00"

GR/JB. Locate top of Otis permanent packer @ ~2806'. POOH, LDGR/JB. MU WL set CICR for
7" 23# casing. RIHand set CICR ~ 5' above Baker permanent packer top (~ 2,801'). Bleed off
pressure from casing while POOH. RDWL.

12. MU slick cement stinger w/ XO's for CICR. Note: Will need 1 joint of replacement tubing to
replace perforated joint. (transfer from Coalville #9)

13. TlH to near top of CICR ~ 2,790'. HU and circulate hole volume w/ fresh water. Pressure test
casing and CICR to 1500 psi to ensure integrity. MU tubing spacing pups w/ safety valve and
tubing swivel. Close safety valve and sting into CICR. Re-test annulus to 500# to ensure CICR seal.

14. Open safety valve on tubing to pump line. Establish injection rate thru CICR. Monitor annulus
pressure during injection test.
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Coalville Gas Storage 12
API 43-043-30249

Plugging Procedure

1. Test / install dead men anchors.
2. MIRUslickline. Set FB tank and run line to same f/ WH for tubing bleed off. RIHw/ 2.80" GR to

locate the Otis "X" nipple w/ 2.75" ID @ ~2823'. POOH and MU 2.75" blanking plug. RIHand
set plug in bottom "X" nipple (~ 2830') POOH. Hang back slickline. HU and bleed off tubing to
FBtank to ensure plug set. RD slickline.

3. MIRU a contract workover rig w/ pipe racks, mud pump, rig tank, and 1 - 400 bbl upright. Fill the
upright with fresh water. Move in and set one 200 bbl cement returns tank. Lay return lines from
flow back and rig tank to the wellhead. Bleed off any remaining well pressures.

4. HU, fill tubing and casing annulus with fresh water taking note of volumes to fill. With annulus
open to tank pressure test tubing and blanking plug to 1500#. Bleed off pressure f/ tubing.

5. RU wireline contractor to perforate the 3-1/2" tubing in the bottom joint above the "Otis Seal
assy" with 6 shots (¼" EH). POOH w/ WL. HU to tubing and establish circulation down tubing
taking returns up casing annulus. Tubing vol. ~ 24 bbl. Casing annulus vol. ~80 bbls. RDWL after
circulation has been established. Note: Annulus fluid may be a petroleum base fluid.

6. ND production tree and NU 7-1/16", 5M hydraulically operated double gate BOP with stripper
head equipped w/ 3-1/2" pipe rams in the top gate and blind rams in the bottom gate. Function-
test both the blind and pipe rams. Hook up pump line to BOPE.

7. Install pup into hanger & PU and un-land tubing and sting out of packer w/ seal assy.
8. Break out and LDhanger, 1 jt of Seal Lock tubing and 2 tubing pups.
9. POOH SB 46 stands of 3-1/2" EUE8rd tubing. LDbottom single perforated jt and the Otis seal

assy. Keep hole full for pipe displacement during trip out.
10. If returns were clean during circulation. NU a 7-1/16" x 3-1/2" EUE8rd companion flange to top

of BOP. RU slickline and RIHand retrieve the blanking plug from lower "X" nipple. RD slickline.
11. MIRUWL contractor with pressure control and lubricator. NU 7-1/16" WL flange. RIHw/ 6.00"

GR/JB. Locate top of Otis permanent packer @ ~2806'. POOH, LDGR/JB. MU WL set CICR for
7" 23# casing. RIHand set CICR ~ 5' above Baker permanent packer top (~ 2,801'). Bleed off
pressure from casing while POOH. RDWL.

12. MU slick cement stinger w/ XO's for CICR. Note: Will need 1 joint of replacement tubing to
replace perforated joint. (transfer from Coalville #9)

13. TlH to near top of CICR ~ 2,790'. HU and circulate hole volume w/ fresh water. Pressure test
casing and CICR to 1500 psi to ensure integrity. MU tubing spacing pups w/ safety valve and
tubing swivel. Close safety valve and sting into CICR. Re-test annulus to 500# to ensure CICR seal.

14. Open safety valve on tubing to pump line. Establish injection rate thru CICR. Monitor annulus
pressure during injection test.

RECEIVED: Mar. 17,

Sundry Number: 70541 API Well Number: 43043302490000

ONESE N -

- - Questar Pipeline Company
333 South State Street
P.O. Box 45360
Salt Lake City, UT 84145
Tel (801) 324-3160
Fax (801) 324-5606

Coalville Gas Storage 12
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locate the Otis "X" nipple w/ 2.75" ID @ ~2823'. POOH and MU 2.75" blanking plug. RIHand
set plug in bottom "X" nipple (~ 2830') POOH. Hang back slickline. HU and bleed off tubing to
FBtank to ensure plug set. RD slickline.

3. MIRU a contract workover rig w/ pipe racks, mud pump, rig tank, and 1 - 400 bbl upright. Fill the
upright with fresh water. Move in and set one 200 bbl cement returns tank. Lay return lines from
flow back and rig tank to the wellhead. Bleed off any remaining well pressures.

4. HU, fill tubing and casing annulus with fresh water taking note of volumes to fill. With annulus
open to tank pressure test tubing and blanking plug to 1500#. Bleed off pressure f/ tubing.

5. RU wireline contractor to perforate the 3-1/2" tubing in the bottom joint above the "Otis Seal
assy" with 6 shots (¼" EH). POOH w/ WL. HU to tubing and establish circulation down tubing
taking returns up casing annulus. Tubing vol. ~ 24 bbl. Casing annulus vol. ~80 bbls. RDWL after
circulation has been established. Note: Annulus fluid may be a petroleum base fluid.

6. ND production tree and NU 7-1/16", 5M hydraulically operated double gate BOP with stripper
head equipped w/ 3-1/2" pipe rams in the top gate and blind rams in the bottom gate. Function-
test both the blind and pipe rams. Hook up pump line to BOPE.

7. Install pup into hanger & PU and un-land tubing and sting out of packer w/ seal assy.
8. Break out and LDhanger, 1 jt of Seal Lock tubing and 2 tubing pups.
9. POOH SB 46 stands of 3-1/2" EUE8rd tubing. LDbottom single perforated jt and the Otis seal

assy. Keep hole full for pipe displacement during trip out.
10. If returns were clean during circulation. NU a 7-1/16" x 3-1/2" EUE8rd companion flange to top

of BOP. RU slickline and RIHand retrieve the blanking plug from lower "X" nipple. RD slickline.
11. MIRUWL contractor with pressure control and lubricator. NU 7-1/16" WL flange. RIHw/ 6.00"

GR/JB. Locate top of Otis permanent packer @ ~2806'. POOH, LDGR/JB. MU WL set CICR for
7" 23# casing. RIHand set CICR ~ 5' above Baker permanent packer top (~ 2,801'). Bleed off
pressure from casing while POOH. RDWL.

12. MU slick cement stinger w/ XO's for CICR. Note: Will need 1 joint of replacement tubing to
replace perforated joint. (transfer from Coalville #9)

13. TlH to near top of CICR ~ 2,790'. HU and circulate hole volume w/ fresh water. Pressure test
casing and CICR to 1500 psi to ensure integrity. MU tubing spacing pups w/ safety valve and
tubing swivel. Close safety valve and sting into CICR. Re-test annulus to 500# to ensure CICR seal.

14. Open safety valve on tubing to pump line. Establish injection rate thru CICR. Monitor annulus
pressure during injection test.
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set plug in bottom "X" nipple (~ 2830') POOH. Hang back slickline. HU and bleed off tubing to
FBtank to ensure plug set. RD slickline.

3. MIRU a contract workover rig w/ pipe racks, mud pump, rig tank, and 1 - 400 bbl upright. Fill the
upright with fresh water. Move in and set one 200 bbl cement returns tank. Lay return lines from
flow back and rig tank to the wellhead. Bleed off any remaining well pressures.

4. HU, fill tubing and casing annulus with fresh water taking note of volumes to fill. With annulus
open to tank pressure test tubing and blanking plug to 1500#. Bleed off pressure f/ tubing.

5. RU wireline contractor to perforate the 3-1/2" tubing in the bottom joint above the "Otis Seal
assy" with 6 shots (¼" EH). POOH w/ WL. HU to tubing and establish circulation down tubing
taking returns up casing annulus. Tubing vol. ~ 24 bbl. Casing annulus vol. ~80 bbls. RDWL after
circulation has been established. Note: Annulus fluid may be a petroleum base fluid.

6. ND production tree and NU 7-1/16", 5M hydraulically operated double gate BOP with stripper
head equipped w/ 3-1/2" pipe rams in the top gate and blind rams in the bottom gate. Function-
test both the blind and pipe rams. Hook up pump line to BOPE.

7. Install pup into hanger & PU and un-land tubing and sting out of packer w/ seal assy.
8. Break out and LDhanger, 1 jt of Seal Lock tubing and 2 tubing pups.
9. POOH SB 46 stands of 3-1/2" EUE8rd tubing. LDbottom single perforated jt and the Otis seal

assy. Keep hole full for pipe displacement during trip out.
10. If returns were clean during circulation. NU a 7-1/16" x 3-1/2" EUE8rd companion flange to top

of BOP. RU slickline and RIHand retrieve the blanking plug from lower "X" nipple. RD slickline.
11. MIRUWL contractor with pressure control and lubricator. NU 7-1/16" WL flange. RIHw/ 6.00"

GR/JB. Locate top of Otis permanent packer @ ~2806'. POOH, LDGR/JB. MU WL set CICR for
7" 23# casing. RIHand set CICR ~ 5' above Baker permanent packer top (~ 2,801'). Bleed off
pressure from casing while POOH. RDWL.

12. MU slick cement stinger w/ XO's for CICR. Note: Will need 1 joint of replacement tubing to
replace perforated joint. (transfer from Coalville #9)

13. TlH to near top of CICR ~ 2,790'. HU and circulate hole volume w/ fresh water. Pressure test
casing and CICR to 1500 psi to ensure integrity. MU tubing spacing pups w/ safety valve and
tubing swivel. Close safety valve and sting into CICR. Re-test annulus to 500# to ensure CICR seal.

14. Open safety valve on tubing to pump line. Establish injection rate thru CICR. Monitor annulus
pressure during injection test.
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15. RU cementing services. 

Cement squeeze#1 

16. Mix and pump 60 sks (15.8 ppg slurry / 1.15 yield 12.2 bbls). Squeeze 40 sks (8.2 bbls) below 
CICR displacing w/ 20 bbls of water. With 20 sks (~4 bbls) left in tubing, sting out and displace 
w/ ~3 bbl of water to balance cement to leave a ~102’ cement plug f/ 2,801’ up to ~2,700’ 
(after tubing pull out) inside the 7’’ 23# casing above CICR. 

17. POOH LD space out pups and 3 jts to ~2700’.  
18. RU cementers and reverse out w/ 30 bbls fresh water. 

9.0# POZ SPACER #1 (2700’ up to 1,585’) 

19. Mix and pump a 9.0# balanced Poz-Gel spacer to place same from 2,700’ up to 1,585’ inside 
7’’ 23 & 20# casing after tubing pull out. ~45 bbls (Assume 9.94 yield)  

20. POOH LD tubing to ~ 1,585’. 

Balanced cement plug #1 (~1585’ - ~1460’) inside 7’’ 20# opposite Inter. Csg shoe  

21. RU cementers. Mix and pump 25 sks (15.8 ppg slury 1.15 yield - 5.2 bbls) of cement to lay in a 
balanced cement plug f/ 1585’ up to 1460’ (125’) inside the 7” 20# casing after tubing pull out.  

22. POOH LD 5 joints of tubing to ~ 1435’. 
23. HU and reverse out f/ ~1435’ w/ 20 bbls fresh water. 

9.0# POZ SPACER #2 (1435’ to surface). 

24. Mix and pump a 9.0# balanced Poz-Gel spacer surface to surface from 1435’ ~53 bbls (Assume 
9.94 yield) 

25. POOH LD all of the tubing. Tubing displacement ~4.8 bbls. (120’ of fluid drop after tubing 
pulled) 

26. ND BOPE, RD and move off rig and assoc. equip. 
27. Remove dead men anchors from private property by unthreading rods from petals 6’ below GL. 
28. Excavate from out around WH (cement was circulated to surface on all casing strings and a 25’ 

KB depth to cement top noted on the 9-5/8’’ casing / cementing report 12-23-83). Cut windows 
in outside casing and cut off and drop 7’’ casing string. 

Surface cement plug (120’ - surface) inside 7’’ 20# casing 

29. Cut off and remove WH equip. at cellar bottom. Top out w/ 25 sks (15.8 ppg cement slurry – 
1.15 yield – 5 bbls) inside the 7’’casing to surface and top out all casing annuli as needed.  

30. After cutting off WH. Move in dirt equip. and remove well pad gravel and pit run material down 
to hay field grade. Excavate around surface casing to 4’ below hay field grade and cut off all 
casing stings.  

31. Install sub surface regulation abandonment marker plate and obtain GPS coordinates for location 
and note in report. Back fill over marker. 
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CICR displacing w/ 20 bbls of water. With 20 sks (~4 bbls) left in tubing, sting out and displace
w/ ~3 bbl of water to balance cement to leave a ~102' cement plug f/ 2,801' up to ~2,700'

(after tubing pull out) inside the 7" 23# casing above CICR.
17. POOH LDspace out pups and 3 jts to ~2700'.
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60 Sk cement squeeze

7", 20#, K-55 Csg @ 3048.10'
PBTD @ 2995' Cement to surface. 600 sks

8-3/4" Hole TD @ 3060'

RECEIVED: Mar. 17,



RECEIVED: Mar. 17, 2016

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Storage Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 COALVILLE GAS STORAGE 12 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QUESTAR PIPELINE COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43043302490000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 P.O.Box 45360 , Salt Lake city , UT, 84145 801 324-5061  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 COALVILLE GAS STORAGE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2170 FSL 1449 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 09 Township: 02.0N Range: 05.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 SUMMIT 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

6 /15 /2016

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Questar Pipeline Company will reclaim property around Coalville Well
#12 after the well head and facilities have been plugged and removed

from the site. The reclamation will be done by grading and leveling the
property and reseeding. This reclamation will be done under the

direction and approval of the current property owner. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Chris B. Balling 801 324-3619

TITLE
 Property Agent - ROW

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 3 /17 /2016

April 05, 2016

Sundry Number: 70545 API Well Number: 43043302490000Sundry Number: 70545 API Well Number: 43043302490000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Storage Well COALVILLEGAS STORAGE 12

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR PIPELINECOMPANY 43043302490000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O.Box 45360 , Salt Lake city , UT, 84145 801 324-5061 Ext COALVILLEGAS STORAGE

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SUMMIT

2170 FSL 1449 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWSE Section: 09 Township: 02.0N Range: 05.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

6/15/2016
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Pipeline Company will reclaim property around Coalville Well Approved by the
#12 after the well head and facilities have been plugged and removed UtpNlt06i,s2fbl6f

from the site. The reclamation will be done by grading and leveling the oil, Gas and Mining

property and reseeding. This reclamation will be done under the Date:
direction and approval of the current property owner.

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Chris B. Balling 801 324-3619 Property Agent - ROW

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 3/17/2016

RECEIVED: Mar. 17,

Sundry Number: 70545 API Well Number: 43043302490000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Storage Well COALVILLEGAS STORAGE 12

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR PIPELINECOMPANY 43043302490000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O.Box 45360 , Salt Lake city , UT, 84145 801 324-5061 Ext COALVILLEGAS STORAGE

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SUMMIT

2170 FSL 1449 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWSE Section: 09 Township: 02.0N Range: 05.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

6/15/2016
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Pipeline Company will reclaim property around Coalville Well Approved by the
#12 after the well head and facilities have been plugged and removed UtpNlt06i,s2fbl6f

from the site. The reclamation will be done by grading and leveling the oil, Gas and Mining

property and reseeding. This reclamation will be done under the Date:
direction and approval of the current property owner.

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Chris B. Balling 801 324-3619 Property Agent - ROW

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 3/17/2016

RECEIVED: Mar. 17,

Sundry Number: 70545 API Well Number: 43043302490000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Storage Well COALVILLEGAS STORAGE 12

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR PIPELINECOMPANY 43043302490000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O.Box 45360 , Salt Lake city , UT, 84145 801 324-5061 Ext COALVILLEGAS STORAGE

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SUMMIT

2170 FSL 1449 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWSE Section: 09 Township: 02.0N Range: 05.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

6/15/2016
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Pipeline Company will reclaim property around Coalville Well Approved by the
#12 after the well head and facilities have been plugged and removed UtpNlt06i,s2fbl6f

from the site. The reclamation will be done by grading and leveling the oil, Gas and Mining

property and reseeding. This reclamation will be done under the Date:
direction and approval of the current property owner.

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Chris B. Balling 801 324-3619 Property Agent - ROW

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 3/17/2016

RECEIVED: Mar. 17,



Daily Operations Report 
Workover 

aUEST~R' 
Wexpro 

Operation 
~ Workover 
r- Repair 

r- Plug & Abandon 

New Perforations 

From To 

7:30 17:00 

Total Hours. 

Well Name Report Date Casing Size Tubing Size Foreman Day 

Coalville Gas Storage 12 I 5/13/2016 I 7" 20# K-S5 I 3-1/2" 9.3# N-SO 
9.2#J-55 I J. Abraham / S.Colvin I S 

slCP slTP FCP FTP Formation PBTO TO W.O. AFE $ AFE 

I I I I LongWaliSS I Surface I 3,060 I 114,550 I 55140 

Existing Perforations 
2890' - 2900' 2SPF 

Detail of Operations in Sequence and Remarks: 
RIg Number: 

Excavated from out around WH. Cut off and fill 20" Mouse hole w/ pit run, removed cellar ring. Cut-off and split 20" conductor. Knock off cement f/ 

around 13-3/8" surface casing. Cut-off 9-5/8" by 11" thread on casing head w/ 11" by 7" tubing head. Cut, split and pull off 13-3/8" surface casing f/ 

around 9-5/8" interm. casing, cut off the 9-5/8" Interm. casing and pull off over the top of 7" production casing, cut off 7" caSing. All casing strings 

cut off 4' below landowners field grade. Cement level inside 7" was 7' below cut off level and cement level between 7" by 9-5/8" was 2-1/2' below 

eut-off. Top out all annuli w/3 sks of sakerete to eut-off level. Weld on regulation abandonment marker plate. Note: L1sha Cordova w/ Utah DOGM 

wittnessed eut-off and cement top-off. Leveled out location pad per land owner and back fill over cover plate. 

9.5 

Surface location by GPS 49.920327, -111.383328. 

95 

Daily Cost: Total Cost: $ 84,403 

RECEIVED 

MAY 1 3 201& 

DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING 
\,. . ." (.'··.·'i""'1 . . lit. ),oA.\'·'V', 

Daily Operations Report Ot/ESEN
wexpm

Workover
Operation Well Name Report Date Casing Size Tubing Size Foreman Day
x workover CoalvilleGas Storage 12 5/13/2016 7" 20# K-55 3-1/2" 9.3# N-80

J. Abraham / S.colvin 8
Repair 9.2# J-55

Plug & Abandon SICP SITP FCP FTP Formation PBTD TD W.O. AFE$ AFE

Long Wall SS Surface 3,060 114,550 55140

New Perforations -ÑO Existing Perforations
2890' - 2900' 2SPF

From To Detail of Operations in Sequence and Remarks:
Rig Number:
Excavated from out around WH. Cut off and fill 20" Mouse hole w/ pit run, removed cellarring. Cut-off and spilt 20" conductor.Knock off ce
around 13-3/8" surface casing. Cut-off 9-5/8" by 11" thread on casing head w/ 11" by 7" tubing head. Cut, split and pull off13-3/8" surface casing f/
around 9-5/8" interm. casing, cut off the 9-5/8" interm. casing and pull off over the top of 7" production casing, cut off 7" casing. AIIcasingstrings
cut off 4' below landowners field grade. Cement level inside 7" was 7' below cut off level and cement level between 7" by 9-5/8" was 2-1/2' below
cut-off. Top out all annuli w/ 3 sks of sakcrete to cut-off level. Weld on regulation abandonment marker plate. Note: Usha Cordova w/ Utah DOGM
wittnessed cut-off and œment top-off. Leveled out location pad per land owner and back fillover cover plate.

7:30 17:00 9.5

Surface location by GPS49.920327, -111.383328.

Total Hours: 9.5

Daily Cost: Total Cost: $ 84 403

RECEIVED
MAY13 2016

DIV.0FOlL,GAS&

Daily Operations Report Ot/ESEN
wexpm

Workover
Operation Well Name Report Date Casing Size Tubing Size Foreman Day
x workover CoalvilleGas Storage 12 5/13/2016 7" 20# K-55 3-1/2" 9.3# N-80

J. Abraham / S.colvin 8
Repair 9.2# J-55

Plug & Abandon SICP SITP FCP FTP Formation PBTD TD W.O. AFE$ AFE

Long Wall SS Surface 3,060 114,550 55140

New Perforations -ÑO Existing Perforations
2890' - 2900' 2SPF

From To Detail of Operations in Sequence and Remarks:
Rig Number:
Excavated from out around WH. Cut off and fill 20" Mouse hole w/ pit run, removed cellarring. Cut-off and spilt 20" conductor.Knock off ce
around 13-3/8" surface casing. Cut-off 9-5/8" by 11" thread on casing head w/ 11" by 7" tubing head. Cut, split and pull off13-3/8" surface casing f/
around 9-5/8" interm. casing, cut off the 9-5/8" interm. casing and pull off over the top of 7" production casing, cut off 7" casing. AIIcasingstrings
cut off 4' below landowners field grade. Cement level inside 7" was 7' below cut off level and cement level between 7" by 9-5/8" was 2-1/2' below
cut-off. Top out all annuli w/ 3 sks of sakcrete to cut-off level. Weld on regulation abandonment marker plate. Note: Usha Cordova w/ Utah DOGM
wittnessed cut-off and œment top-off. Leveled out location pad per land owner and back fillover cover plate.

7:30 17:00 9.5

Surface location by GPS49.920327, -111.383328.

Total Hours: 9.5

Daily Cost: Total Cost: $ 84 403

RECEIVED
MAY13 2016

DIV.0FOlL,GAS&



Daily Operations Report 
Workover 

QUEST .. R' 
Wexpro 

Operation 
~ Worlcover 
r- Repair 

r- Plug & Abandon 

New Perforations 

From To 

6:30 7:00 

7:00 7:45 

7:45 8:30 

8:30 9:30 

9:30 10:30 

10:30 11:30 

11:30 12:00 

12:00 13:30 

13:30 16:00 

16:00 17:00 

Total Hours: 

Well Name Report Date Casing Size Tubing Size Foreman Day 

7" 20# K-55 I 3-1/2" 93# N-80 I S, Colvin J 7 
9.2#J-55 

Coalville Gas Storage 12 I 5/10/2016 I 
slCP slTP FCP FTP Formation PBTD TO W.O.AFE$ AFE 

o I 0 I I I LongWaliSS I Surface I 3.060 I 114.550 I 55140 

0.5 

0.8 

0.8 

1.0 

1.0 

1.0 

0.5 

1.5 

2.5 

1.0 

10.5 

Existing Perforations 
2890' - 2900' 2SPF 

Detail of Operations in Sequence and Remarks: 
RIg Number: Key 6052 

PJSM, PU 4 jts. Mushy cement @ 420' kbm and set 3500# string wt on solid cement @ 441' kbm (13' in on jt #15) 

POOH LD 2 jOints. HU and circulated conventional w/ 12 bbls for btms up. Mix and pump 11 bbls of 9.0# paz gel (6 sks) to leave spacer inside 7" f/ 

400 to 125' after tubing pull out. POOH LO remaining 13 jts. 

RU WL, RIH w/ 1-11/16" 00 perf gun. Perforated casing@125' KBM. POOH RO WL. Closed blind rams. HU cementer and attempt to circulate f/ 125' 

up 9-5/8" x 7" annulus. Pressure up to 2200# and pressure solid w/ no psi loss. Bleed off pressure. 

PU RIH w/ 6 joints to 183' kbm. HU cementers to tubing. Mix and pump 7 bbls of 15.8 ppg cement (35sks Neat "G") surface to surface. POOH LO 5 

joints. Burst coolant hose on rig engine. SO and make tempory repair to rig. POOH LO last jt and wash slips,tongs and BOPE. 

Repair coolant hose on rig. 

PU MU "Bowen Intemal cutter" RIH to 3' below GL. Cut off 7" casing. LD cutter assy. 

Breakf/lunch. RO & move cementing equip. to CVL #7 location. 

RO floor and tools, NO BOPE. RO rig. After removing BOP measured down to cut off. Cut is 3' below GL or 17.60' below KB 

Rack out pump, lines & equip. make ready for rig move. 

Move by forklift 94 joints of 3-1/2" tubing to landowners back forty and stack same. Hual off water to D&B disposal in Bridger valle .... SOFO 

Daily Cost: $ 

Will excavate remove pad around WH down to 4' below field grade 5-12-16 

27,757 Total Cost: $ 84,403 

RECEIVED 

MAY 1 ~. -281 
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING 

.~:~.".~ ... ~~~:~~};C,l!~J 

, 

Daily Operations Report OllESEN
wexpro

Workover
Operation Well Name Report Date Casing Size Tubing Size Foreman Day
x workover CoalvilleGas Storage 12 5/10/2016 7" 20# K-55 3-1/2" 9.3# N-80

S. Colvin 7
Repair 9.2# J-55

Plug & Abandon SICP SITP FCP FTP Formation PBTD TD W.O. AFE$ AFE

O O Long Wall SS Surface 3,060 114,550 55140

New Perforations 4g-Ö96- Existing Perforations
890' - 2900' 2SPF

From To Detall of Operations in Sequence and Remarks:
Rig Number: Key 6052

6:30 7:00 0.5 PJSM, PU 4 jts. Mushy cement @420' kbm and set 3500# string wt on solid cement @441' kbm (13' in on jt #15)
POOHLD2 joints. HUand circulated conventional w/ 12 bbis for btms up. Mix and pump 11 bbis of 9.0# por gel (6 sks) to leave spacer inside 7" f/

7:0D 7:45 0.8 400 to 125' after tubing pull out. POOHLDremaining 13 jts.
RU WL, RIH w/ 1-11/16" OD perf gun. Perforated casing @125'KBM.POOH RDWL.Closed blind rams. HUcementer and attempt to circulate f/ 125'

7:45 8:30 0.8 up 9-5/8" x 7" annulus. Pressure up to 2200#and pressure solid w/ no psi loss. Bleed off pressure.
PU RIHw/ 6 joints to 183' kbm. HU cementers to tubing. Mix and pump 7 bbis of 15.8 ppg cement (35sks Neat "G") surface to surfaœ. POOH LD5

8:30 9:30 1.0 joints. Burst coolant hose on rig engine. SDand make tempory repair to rig. POOH LDlast jt and wash slips,tongs and BOPE.
9:30 10:30 1.0 Repair coolant hose on rig.
10:30 11:30 1.0 PU MU "Bowen Intemai cutter" RIHto 3' below GL Cut off 7" casing. LD cutter assy.
11:30 12:00 0.5 Breakf/lunch. RD& move cementing equip. to CVL #7 location.
12:00 13:30 1.5 RDfloor and tools, NDBOPE.RDrig. After removing BOP measured down to cut off. Cut is 3' below GL or 17.60' below KB
13:30 16:00 2.5 Rack out pump, lines & equip. make ready for rig move.
16:00 17:00 1.0 Move by forklift 94 joints of 3-1/2" tubing to landowners back forty and stack same. Hual offwater to D&Bdisposal in Bridger valley. SDFD

Willexcavate remove pad around WH down to 4' below field grade 5-12-16

Total Hours: 10.5

Daily Cost: $ 27,757 Total Cost: $ 84,403

RECEIVED
MAY19 208

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&

Daily Operations Report OllESEN
wexpro

Workover
Operation Well Name Report Date Casing Size Tubing Size Foreman Day
x workover CoalvilleGas Storage 12 5/10/2016 7" 20# K-55 3-1/2" 9.3# N-80

S. Colvin 7
Repair 9.2# J-55

Plug & Abandon SICP SITP FCP FTP Formation PBTD TD W.O. AFE$ AFE

O O Long Wall SS Surface 3,060 114,550 55140

New Perforations 4g-Ö96- Existing Perforations
890' - 2900' 2SPF

From To Detall of Operations in Sequence and Remarks:
Rig Number: Key 6052

6:30 7:00 0.5 PJSM, PU 4 jts. Mushy cement @420' kbm and set 3500# string wt on solid cement @441' kbm (13' in on jt #15)
POOHLD2 joints. HUand circulated conventional w/ 12 bbis for btms up. Mix and pump 11 bbis of 9.0# por gel (6 sks) to leave spacer inside 7" f/

7:0D 7:45 0.8 400 to 125' after tubing pull out. POOHLDremaining 13 jts.
RU WL, RIH w/ 1-11/16" OD perf gun. Perforated casing @125'KBM.POOH RDWL.Closed blind rams. HUcementer and attempt to circulate f/ 125'

7:45 8:30 0.8 up 9-5/8" x 7" annulus. Pressure up to 2200#and pressure solid w/ no psi loss. Bleed off pressure.
PU RIHw/ 6 joints to 183' kbm. HU cementers to tubing. Mix and pump 7 bbis of 15.8 ppg cement (35sks Neat "G") surface to surfaœ. POOH LD5

8:30 9:30 1.0 joints. Burst coolant hose on rig engine. SDand make tempory repair to rig. POOH LDlast jt and wash slips,tongs and BOPE.
9:30 10:30 1.0 Repair coolant hose on rig.
10:30 11:30 1.0 PU MU "Bowen Intemai cutter" RIHto 3' below GL Cut off 7" casing. LD cutter assy.
11:30 12:00 0.5 Breakf/lunch. RD& move cementing equip. to CVL #7 location.
12:00 13:30 1.5 RDfloor and tools, NDBOPE.RDrig. After removing BOP measured down to cut off. Cut is 3' below GL or 17.60' below KB
13:30 16:00 2.5 Rack out pump, lines & equip. make ready for rig move.
16:00 17:00 1.0 Move by forklift 94 joints of 3-1/2" tubing to landowners back forty and stack same. Hual offwater to D&Bdisposal in Bridger valley. SDFD

Willexcavate remove pad around WH down to 4' below field grade 5-12-16

Total Hours: 10.5

Daily Cost: $ 27,757 Total Cost: $ 84,403

RECEIVED
MAY19 208

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



Daily Operations Report 
Workover 

QUEST~R' 
Wexpro 

Operation Well Name Report Date Casing Size Tubing Size Foreman Day 

j;oRover Coalville Gas Storage 12 I S/9/2016 I 7" 20# K-SS I 3-1/2" 9.3# N-80 I S. Colvin I 6 
Repair 9.2#J-SS 

Plug & Abandon SICP SITP 7" x9-S/S" FTP Formation PBTD TO W.O. AFE $ AFE 

0 I 0 I 0 I I long Wall SS I 2,99S I 3,060 I 114,S5O I SS140 

New Perforations '-l'3-CJL/1$-'3{) 2tt ~ Existing Perforations 

2890' - 2900' 2SPF 

From To Detail of Operations in Sequence and Remarks' 

R/gNumber: Key 6052 

6:30 7:00 0,5 Check pressures, started equip. PJSM 

lIsha Cordova w/ Utah DNR on location to wittness pressure tests and cementing operations. Pressure tested casing annulus to 1060# and held for 

10 min.(tubing open to atmos.) with no pressure losses. Bleed off pressure. HU to tubing, open pipe rams. Sting out of CICR. established circulation 

by reverse. Circulated 20 bbls, wash into CICR twice. Sting into retainer and attempted injection test. Pressure up to 2500#. Lost 50# in 5 min. 

Contacted Dustin Doucet w/ Ut. DNR and obtained approval to lay in a 200' 15.8# cement plug above CICR and to perforate the 7" production casing 

7:00 8:00 1.0 @ 125' at finish for surface plug. 

8:00 9:30 1.5 Take Basic Energy cement blimp to CVL #7 location for stagging of cement product. Spot in RU cementers. RU Baker cement manifold. 
9:30 9:45 0.3 PJSM on cementing operations. 

Pressure tested lines 2000#. Set manifold to pump down tubing. Attempted to circulate 5 bbls of fresh water ahead of cement. Baker squeeze 
9:45 10:00 0.3 manifold cemented closed at bleed off valve. RD manifold, HU to casing and tubing for spotting plugs. 
10:00 10:15 0.3 Mix and pump 8.1 bbls of slurry (16.0 ppg4Osks) Neat "G" cement. 
10:15 10:30 0.3 Displaced cement w/22 bbls of fresh water to leave a 200' plug f/ 2795' up to 2595'. POOH LD 8 jts. EOT @ 2555'. 

Reverse out w/ 30 bbls of fresh water,1/2 bbl cement & 1/2 bbl dirty water at btms up. Mix and pump 40 bbls of 9.0 ppg Poz-gel (22sks) and 
10:30 11:15 0.8 displaced same w/13 bbls water to balance for Paz spacer 2555' up to 1580'. 
11:15 11:45 0.5 B/O pump line. Tubing standing full and balanced.POOH LD 33 jts to 1580'. HU cementers. 

Mix and pump 4.1 bbls of 15.5 PPI -16.1+PPI cement slurry (25 sks) mixed w/ 2% cacl & lay in a balanced cement plug f/ 1580 up to 1454' (inside a 

7" after tubing pull out). Displaced same w/ 13 bbls fresh water for balance. Bleed back 1/4 bbl displacement to cementer tubing is balanced. POOH 

11:45 12:15 0.5 LD 5 Jts. HU and reverse out f/ 1431' w/20 bbls. 3/4 bbl dirty water at btms up. POOH w/ 1 stand. 

12:15 13:00 0.8 Break f/ lunch. 

Pull stripper rubber.POOH 58 23 more stands B/O LD stinger. Load out squeeze manifold. PU MU 6' tubing pup to first stand. TIH w/ 23 stands. 
13:00 14:15 1.3 

14:15 16:00 1.8 Waiting on surface cement sample to set up to tag. 

RIH w/ stand #24. PU 1 single and set 5k of string wt down on plug @ 1434' kbm LD single. HU and pump 36 bbls of 9.0 ppg poz-gel spacer (21sks) 
16:00 16:30 0.5 f/1431' up to 543' (inside 7" casing after tubing pUIl-out). Displace w/4 bbls water to balance. 
16:30 17:00 0.5 RD cementers. POOH LD 30 Jts to 543'. RU cementers. 

Establish circulation.Mix and pump 4.1 bbls of 15.8 ppg -16.1+ppg cement slurry (25 sks) to lay in a balanced cement plug f/ 543' up to 418' ( 
inside of 7" after tubing pull out). Displaced cement w/ 3.5 bbls fresh water. Tubing was balanced. POOH LD 5 Jts. HU and reverse out f/ 399' w/8 

bbls. 3/4 bbl dirty water at btms up 1/4 bbl cement. POOH LD 2 joints. Leave EOT @ 340' FN. SIW. Clean cement returns tank with hydra-vac and 

17:00 18:00 1.0 hauled to disposal. SW5DFD 

Total Hours: 11.5 

Dally Cost: $ 1S,263 Total Cost: $ 56,646 

RECEIVED 

t! ~ 09 2016 ) 
DIY. OF OIL, GAS & MINING ) 

• ... "',,. _"i',dS', .j ... , ;· .• ;J,',,:;.~ .• ,:.~ .• M.;,,'_""~'·~'" 
~" ".;':,' ""t ~ ..... ~ :.,.~;~;; -'= ~ ~ ~~ • :1t:!CIII~~. 

DailyOperations Report OllESTAN
Workover

I¥expm

Operation Well Name Report Date Casing Size Tubing Size Foreman Day
x Workover CoalvilleGas Storage 12 5/9/2016 7" 20# K-55 3-1/2" 9.3# N-80

5. Colvin 6Repair 9.2# J-55

Plug & Abandon SICP SITP 7" x 9-5/8" FTP Formation PBTD TD W.O. AFE$ AFE

O 0 0 Long Wall SS 2,995 3,060 114,550 55140

New Perforations -S Existing Perforations
2890' - 2900' 2SPF

From TO Detail of Operations in Sequence and Remarks:
Rig Number: Key 6052

6:30 7:00 0.5 Check pressures, started equip. PJSM
Lisha Cordova w/ Utah DNR on location to wittness pressure tests and cementing operations. Pressure tested casing annulusto 1060#and held for
10 min.(tubing open to atmos.) with no pressure losses. Bleed off pressure. HUto tubing , open pipe rams. Sting out of CICR.established circulation
by reverse. Circulated 20 bbis, wash into CICR twice. Sting into retainer and attempted injection test. Pressure up to 2500#. Lost 50#in 5 min.
Contacted Dustin Doucet w/ Ut. DNR and obtained approval to lay in a 200' 15.8#cement plug above CICRand to perforate the 7" production casing

7:00 8:00 1.0 @125' at finish for surface plug.
8:00 9:30 1.5 T t blimp to CVL#7 location for stagging of cement product. Spot in RUcementers. RU Baker cement manifold.
9:30 9:45 0.3 PJSMon cementing operations.

Pressure tested Ilnes 2000#. Set manifold to pump down tubing. Attempted to circulate 5 bbis of fresh water ahead of cement.Baker squeeze
9:45 10:00 0.3 manifold cemented closed at bleed off valve. RDmanifold. HU to casing and tubing for spotting plugs.

10:00 10:15 0.3 Mix and pump 8.1 bbis of slurry (16.0 ppg 40sks) Neat "G" cement.
10:15 10:30 0.3 D bh of fresh water to leave a 200' plug f/ 2795' up to 2595'. POOH LD8 Jts.EOT@2555'.

Reverse out w/ 30 bbis of fresh water,1/2 bbi cement & 1/2 bbl dirty waterat btms up. Mix and pump 40 bbis of 9.0 ppg Poz-gel (22sks) and
10:30 11:15 0.8 displaced same w/13 bbis water to balance for Poz spacer 2555' up to 1580'.
11:15 11:45 0.5 B/O pump line. Tubing standing full and balanced.POOH LD33 jts to 1580'. HUcementers.

Mix and pump 4.1 bbis of 15.5 ppg -16.1+ppg cement slurry (25 sks)mixedw/ 2% Cacl & lay in a balanced cement plug f/1580 up to 1454' (inside of
7" after tubing pull out). Displaœd samew/13 bbis fresh water for balance. Bleed back 1/4 bbl displacement to cementer tubing is balanced. POOH

11:45 12:15 0.5 LD5 Jts. HU and reverseout f/1431' w/ 20 bbis. 3/4 bbl dirty water at btms up. POOH w/ 1stand.
12:15 13:00 0.8 Break f/ Iunch.

13:00 14:15 1.3

Pull stripper rubber.POOH SB23 more stands B/O LDstinger. Load out squeeze runifoÑ.PU MU 6' tubing pup to first stand. TlHw/ 23 stands.

14:15 16:00 1.8 Waiting on surface cement sample to set up to tag.
RIH w|stand #24. PU 1single and set 5k of string wt down on plug @1434' kbm LDsingle. HU and pump 36 bbis of 9.0 ppg poz-gel spacer (21sks)

16:00 16:30 0.5 f/1431' up to 543' (inside 7" casing after tubing pull-out). Displace w/ 4 bbis water to balance.
16:30 17:00 0.5 RDcementers.POOH LD30 Jts to 543'. RUcementers.

Establish circulation.Mix and pump 4.1 bbis of 15.8 ppg -16.1+ppg cement sluny (25 sks) to lay in a balanced cement plug f/ 543' up to 418' (
inside of 7" after tubing pull out). Displaced cementw/ 3.5 bbis fresh water. Tubing was balanced. POOH LD5 Jts. HUand reverse out f/ 399' w/ 8
bbis. 3/4 bbi dirty water at btms up 1/4 bbl cement. POOH LD2 Joints.Leave EOT@340' FN.SIW.Clean cement returnstank with hydra-vac and

17:00 18:00 1.0 hauled to disposal. SWSDFD

I
Total Hours: 11.5

Daily Cost: $ 18,263 Total Cost: $ 56,646

RECEIVED
MAY09 2016

DIV.0FOlt,GAS&

DailyOperations Report OllESTAN
Workover

I¥expm

Operation Well Name Report Date Casing Size Tubing Size Foreman Day
x Workover CoalvilleGas Storage 12 5/9/2016 7" 20# K-55 3-1/2" 9.3# N-80

5. Colvin 6Repair 9.2# J-55

Plug & Abandon SICP SITP 7" x 9-5/8" FTP Formation PBTD TD W.O. AFE$ AFE

O 0 0 Long Wall SS 2,995 3,060 114,550 55140

New Perforations -S Existing Perforations
2890' - 2900' 2SPF

From TO Detail of Operations in Sequence and Remarks:
Rig Number: Key 6052

6:30 7:00 0.5 Check pressures, started equip. PJSM
Lisha Cordova w/ Utah DNR on location to wittness pressure tests and cementing operations. Pressure tested casing annulusto 1060#and held for
10 min.(tubing open to atmos.) with no pressure losses. Bleed off pressure. HUto tubing , open pipe rams. Sting out of CICR.established circulation
by reverse. Circulated 20 bbis, wash into CICR twice. Sting into retainer and attempted injection test. Pressure up to 2500#. Lost 50#in 5 min.
Contacted Dustin Doucet w/ Ut. DNR and obtained approval to lay in a 200' 15.8#cement plug above CICRand to perforate the 7" production casing

7:00 8:00 1.0 @125' at finish for surface plug.
8:00 9:30 1.5 T t blimp to CVL#7 location for stagging of cement product. Spot in RUcementers. RU Baker cement manifold.
9:30 9:45 0.3 PJSMon cementing operations.

Pressure tested Ilnes 2000#. Set manifold to pump down tubing. Attempted to circulate 5 bbis of fresh water ahead of cement.Baker squeeze
9:45 10:00 0.3 manifold cemented closed at bleed off valve. RDmanifold. HU to casing and tubing for spotting plugs.

10:00 10:15 0.3 Mix and pump 8.1 bbis of slurry (16.0 ppg 40sks) Neat "G" cement.
10:15 10:30 0.3 D bh of fresh water to leave a 200' plug f/ 2795' up to 2595'. POOH LD8 Jts.EOT@2555'.

Reverse out w/ 30 bbis of fresh water,1/2 bbi cement & 1/2 bbl dirty waterat btms up. Mix and pump 40 bbis of 9.0 ppg Poz-gel (22sks) and
10:30 11:15 0.8 displaced same w/13 bbis water to balance for Poz spacer 2555' up to 1580'.
11:15 11:45 0.5 B/O pump line. Tubing standing full and balanced.POOH LD33 jts to 1580'. HUcementers.

Mix and pump 4.1 bbis of 15.5 ppg -16.1+ppg cement slurry (25 sks)mixedw/ 2% Cacl & lay in a balanced cement plug f/1580 up to 1454' (inside of
7" after tubing pull out). Displaœd samew/13 bbis fresh water for balance. Bleed back 1/4 bbl displacement to cementer tubing is balanced. POOH

11:45 12:15 0.5 LD5 Jts. HU and reverseout f/1431' w/ 20 bbis. 3/4 bbl dirty water at btms up. POOH w/ 1stand.
12:15 13:00 0.8 Break f/ Iunch.

13:00 14:15 1.3

Pull stripper rubber.POOH SB23 more stands B/O LDstinger. Load out squeeze runifoÑ.PU MU 6' tubing pup to first stand. TlHw/ 23 stands.

14:15 16:00 1.8 Waiting on surface cement sample to set up to tag.
RIH w|stand #24. PU 1single and set 5k of string wt down on plug @1434' kbm LDsingle. HU and pump 36 bbis of 9.0 ppg poz-gel spacer (21sks)

16:00 16:30 0.5 f/1431' up to 543' (inside 7" casing after tubing pull-out). Displace w/ 4 bbis water to balance.
16:30 17:00 0.5 RDcementers.POOH LD30 Jts to 543'. RUcementers.

Establish circulation.Mix and pump 4.1 bbis of 15.8 ppg -16.1+ppg cement sluny (25 sks) to lay in a balanced cement plug f/ 543' up to 418' (
inside of 7" after tubing pull out). Displaced cementw/ 3.5 bbis fresh water. Tubing was balanced. POOH LD5 Jts. HUand reverse out f/ 399' w/ 8
bbis. 3/4 bbi dirty water at btms up 1/4 bbl cement. POOH LD2 Joints.Leave EOT@340' FN.SIW.Clean cement returnstank with hydra-vac and

17:00 18:00 1.0 hauled to disposal. SWSDFD

I
Total Hours: 11.5

Daily Cost: $ 18,263 Total Cost: $ 56,646

RECEIVED
MAY09 2016

DIV.0FOlt,GAS&



Daily Operations Report 
Workover 

aUEST~R' 
Wexpro 

Operation Well Name Report Date casing Size Tubing Size Foreman Day 

r!. workover Coalville Gas Storage 12 I 5/7/2016 I 7" 20# K-55 I 3-1/2" 9.3# N-80 I S, Colvin I 4 r- Repair 9.2# J-55 

r- Plug & Abandon SICP SITP 7" xg-S/S" FTP Formation PBm m W.O. AFE $ AFE 

0 I 0 I 5 I I longWaliSS I 2,995 I 3,060 I 114,550 I 55140 

New Perforations tt~-oIlt.3-86?-Y- ~ Existing Perforations 

2890' - 2900' 2SPF 

From To Detail of Operations in Sequence and Remarks: 

RIg Number: Key Energy 6052 

Started equip" check pressures, PJSM, PU on tubing to 70k, lower back down to 30k, Set tubing in slips, RU KLX Wl, MU 2-7/16 00 chemical cutter, 
6:30 7:30 1,0 

RIH wI cutter, Correlated to packer top @ 2813' fl origanal tubing report, PUH wI CCl to 2798', cut tubing @ 2807' ( 6' above SA origanal tubing 

report), POOH wI Wl, LD tools,RO WL PU on tubing - Tubing free at string wt of 22k, POOH LD hanger and top joint, Install wiper rubber, POOH 6 & 
7:30 9:30 2,0 8' tubing pups, POOH SB 46 stands in derrick, lO bottom perforated and cut off piece 24,08', 

Filled hole wI 10 bbls of water, NO stripper head, NU 7-1/6".3-1/2" eue companion flange, RU Northern lights sllckline, RIH, wI centrilized 1.875" 

00 OS, attempt to stab into Cut-off stub above SA@, Could not get into stub, POOH, MU 2,231" 00 "Flintstone camera" RIH and set down on stub 
9:30 12:00 2,5 @ 2807' kbm, POOH, block showed clean fish top on 3_1/2" tubing, 

MU prong pulling tool, reconfigure tool string wlo centrilizer, RIH and again try to stab Inside of stub wI no success, POOH, Reconfigure tool string 

wI 1- 2"_ 5' wt bar on bottom above OS, RIH and again attempt to get inside of the cut-off stub wI no success, POOH RO slickline, RU WL 
12:00 14:00 2,0 

MU 1-11/16" tubing perf gun dressed 4 spf wll centrilizer above CCL ,10' wt bar, 2nd centrilizer and 10' wt, bar, RIH, located Into top of cut-off 

stub, RIH and correlate to packer top, RI and set down on 2,75" PX plug @ 2835' KBM, Pressure up on casing wI rig pump to 500#, Perforated the 

lower 6' tubing pup 2834', Pressure slowly bled to 100# then to 0#, POOH, LD perf gun and 3" lubricator, NO 7-1/16" • 3-1/2" companion flange, 

14:00 16:00 2,0 NU 7-1/16" 5k Wl flange, 

MU PU 5" lubricator, MU RIH wI 5.75" 00 GR Pressure up on lubricator wI rig pump to 500#, Opened rams, RIH to 2807' KBM, POOH closed rams 

and bleed off lubrlcator,lO GR/JB, MU 7" WLS CICR. PU Equalize lubricator to 500# wI rig pump, NOTE: Ouring pressure up of lubricator rig pump 

operator caught pressure faster than anticipated and pressured up to 1000# rocking lubricator above BOPE, it was then noticed that the tubing head 

was loose @ the 10" 3k flange @ casing head. Bolts are hand tight only 1111 Open rams and RIH wI CICR, Correlated on depth CBl dated 1-20-84, RIH 

and lightly set down wI CICR on tubing stub @ 2,800' WlM, PUH 5' and set the CICR @ 2802' KBM orig tubing report (2,795' WlM), POOH bleed off 

16:00 19:00 3,0 casing pressure to rig tank, RO Wl, 

Stalghten up BOPE and tubing head. Tighten bolts on tubing head @ 4 comers, Arrange for cameron to be on location In morning wI hyd torque 

wrench and test equipJor testing void on pack-off of the tubing head, 4' diameter cellar ring preventing good swing of hammer to tighten bolts, 
19:00 19:30 0,5 SISWSOFO, 

Total Hours. 13.0 

Dally Cost: $ 14,344 Total Cost: $ 32,031 

'::' 

RECEIVED 

MAY 09 2016 
.. ~ , 

Daily Operations Report Ot/ESTÆN
Wexpm

Workover
Operation Well Name Report Date Casing Size Tubing Size Foreman Day
x workover CoalvilleGas Storage 12 5/7/2016 7" 20# K-55 3-1/2" 9.3# N-80 S. Colvin 4

Repair 9.2#1-55
Plug & Abandon SICP SITP 7" x 9-5/8" FTP Formation PBTD TD W.O. AFE$ AFE

0 0 5 Long Wall SS 2,995 3,060 114,550 55140

New Perforations 6-Û 6- Existing Perforations
2890°

- 2900' 25PF

From To Detail of Operations in Sequence and Remarks:
Rig Number: Key Energy 6052
Started equip., check pressures, PJSM. PU on tubing to 70k, Iower back down to 30k. Set tubing in slips. RU KLXWL, MU 2-7/16 ODchemical cutter.

6:30 7:30 1.0

RIH w/ cutter. Correlated to packer top @ 2813' f/ origanal tubing report. PUHw/ CCLto 2798', cut tubing @ 2807' (6' above SAoriganal tubing
report). POOH w/ WL, LDtools,RD WL.PU on tubing -Tubing free at string wt of 22k. POOH LDhanger and top Joint.Install wiper rubber. POOH 6 &

7:30 9:30 2.0 8' tubing pups. POOH SB46 stands in derrick. LDbottom perforated and cut off piece 24.08'.
Filled hole w/10 bbis of water. NDstripper head, NU 7-1/6" x 3-1/2" eue companion flange. RUNorthern lights slickline. RiH. w/ centrilized 1.875"
OD OS, attempt to stab into cut-offstub above SA @.Could not get into stub. POOH,MU 2.231" OD "Flintstone camera" RiH and set down on stub

9:30 12:00 2.5 @2807' kbm. POOH, block showed clean fish top on 3-1/2" tubing.
MU prong pulling tool, reconfigure tool string w/o centrilizer. RIHand again try to stab inside of stub w/ no success. POOH. Reconfigure tool string
w/1- 2"- 5' wt bar on bottom above OS. RIHand again attempt to get inside of the cut-off stub w/ no success. POOHRDslickline. RUWL.

12:00 14:00 2.0
MU 1-11/16" tubing perf gun dressed 4 spf w/ 1centrilizer above CCL,10' wt bar, 2nd centrilizer and 10' wt. bar. RIH,located into top of cut-off
stub. RIHand correlate to packer top. RIand set down on 2.75" PX plug @2835' KBM.Pressure up on casing w/ rig pump to 500#. Perforated the
lower 6' tubing pup 2834'. Pressure slowly bled to 10D#then to0#. POOH. LDperf gun and 3" lubricator. ND 7-1/16" x 3-1/2" companion flange.

14:00 16:00 2.0 NU 7-1/16" 5k WLflange.
MU PU 5" lubricator. MU RIH w/ 5.75" OD GR Pressure up on lubricator w/ rig pump to 500#. Opened rams, RIH to 2807' KBM.POOHclosed rams
and bleed off lubricator.LD GR/JB. MU 7" WLSCICR.PU Equalize lubricator to 500# w/ rig pump. NOTE:During pressure up of lubricator rig pump
operator caught pressure faster than anticipated and pressured up to 1000# rocking lubricator above BOPE,it was then noticed that the tubing head
was loose @the 10" 3k flange @casing head. Bolts are hand tight only IIII Open rams and RIH w/ CICR.Correlated on depth CBLdated 1-20-84. RIH

and lightly set down w/ CICRon tubing stub @2,800' WLM.PUH5' and set the CICR@2802' KBM orig tubing report (2,795' WLM). POOH bleed off
16:00 19:00 3.0 casing pressure to rig tank. RDWL.

Staighten up BoPE and tubing head. Tighten bolts on tubing head @4 corners. Arrange for Cameron to be on location in morning w/ hyd torque
wrench and test equip.for testing void on pack-off of the tubing head.4' diameter cellar ring preventing good swing of hammer to tighten bolts.

19:00 19:30 0.5 SISW SDFD.

Total Hours: 13.0

DaHyCost: $ 14,344 Total Cost: $ 32,031

Daily Operations Report Ot/ESTÆN
Wexpm

Workover
Operation Well Name Report Date Casing Size Tubing Size Foreman Day
x workover CoalvilleGas Storage 12 5/7/2016 7" 20# K-55 3-1/2" 9.3# N-80 S. Colvin 4

Repair 9.2#1-55
Plug & Abandon SICP SITP 7" x 9-5/8" FTP Formation PBTD TD W.O. AFE$ AFE

0 0 5 Long Wall SS 2,995 3,060 114,550 55140

New Perforations 6-Û 6- Existing Perforations
2890°

- 2900' 25PF

From To Detail of Operations in Sequence and Remarks:
Rig Number: Key Energy 6052
Started equip., check pressures, PJSM. PU on tubing to 70k, Iower back down to 30k. Set tubing in slips. RU KLXWL, MU 2-7/16 ODchemical cutter.

6:30 7:30 1.0

RIH w/ cutter. Correlated to packer top @ 2813' f/ origanal tubing report. PUHw/ CCLto 2798', cut tubing @ 2807' (6' above SAoriganal tubing
report). POOH w/ WL, LDtools,RD WL.PU on tubing -Tubing free at string wt of 22k. POOH LDhanger and top Joint.Install wiper rubber. POOH 6 &

7:30 9:30 2.0 8' tubing pups. POOH SB46 stands in derrick. LDbottom perforated and cut off piece 24.08'.
Filled hole w/10 bbis of water. NDstripper head, NU 7-1/6" x 3-1/2" eue companion flange. RUNorthern lights slickline. RiH. w/ centrilized 1.875"
OD OS, attempt to stab into cut-offstub above SA @.Could not get into stub. POOH,MU 2.231" OD "Flintstone camera" RiH and set down on stub

9:30 12:00 2.5 @2807' kbm. POOH, block showed clean fish top on 3-1/2" tubing.
MU prong pulling tool, reconfigure tool string w/o centrilizer. RIHand again try to stab inside of stub w/ no success. POOH. Reconfigure tool string
w/1- 2"- 5' wt bar on bottom above OS. RIHand again attempt to get inside of the cut-off stub w/ no success. POOHRDslickline. RUWL.

12:00 14:00 2.0
MU 1-11/16" tubing perf gun dressed 4 spf w/ 1centrilizer above CCL,10' wt bar, 2nd centrilizer and 10' wt. bar. RIH,located into top of cut-off
stub. RIHand correlate to packer top. RIand set down on 2.75" PX plug @2835' KBM.Pressure up on casing w/ rig pump to 500#. Perforated the
lower 6' tubing pup 2834'. Pressure slowly bled to 10D#then to0#. POOH. LDperf gun and 3" lubricator. ND 7-1/16" x 3-1/2" companion flange.

14:00 16:00 2.0 NU 7-1/16" 5k WLflange.
MU PU 5" lubricator. MU RIH w/ 5.75" OD GR Pressure up on lubricator w/ rig pump to 500#. Opened rams, RIH to 2807' KBM.POOHclosed rams
and bleed off lubricator.LD GR/JB. MU 7" WLSCICR.PU Equalize lubricator to 500# w/ rig pump. NOTE:During pressure up of lubricator rig pump
operator caught pressure faster than anticipated and pressured up to 1000# rocking lubricator above BOPE,it was then noticed that the tubing head
was loose @the 10" 3k flange @casing head. Bolts are hand tight only IIII Open rams and RIH w/ CICR.Correlated on depth CBLdated 1-20-84. RIH

and lightly set down w/ CICRon tubing stub @2,800' WLM.PUH5' and set the CICR@2802' KBM orig tubing report (2,795' WLM). POOH bleed off
16:00 19:00 3.0 casing pressure to rig tank. RDWL.

Staighten up BoPE and tubing head. Tighten bolts on tubing head @4 corners. Arrange for Cameron to be on location in morning w/ hyd torque
wrench and test equip.for testing void on pack-off of the tubing head.4' diameter cellar ring preventing good swing of hammer to tighten bolts.

19:00 19:30 0.5 SISW SDFD.

Total Hours: 13.0

DaHyCost: $ 14,344 Total Cost: $ 32,031



Daily Operations Report 
Workover 

aUEST~R' 
Wexpro 

Operation Well Name Report Date Casing Size Tubing Size Foreman Day 
2!. Workover 

Coalville Gas Storage 12 I 5/6/2016 I 7" 20# K-55 I 3-1/2" 93# N-SO I S. Colvin I 3 
_ Repair 9.2#J-55 

_ Plug & Abandon SICP SITP 7" x9-S/8" FTP Formation PBTD TO W.O.AFE$ AFE 

0 I 0 I 5 I I long Wall SS I 2,995 I 3,060 I 114,550 I 55140 

New Perforations !.f-;-ott~-"30-,J{ tt Existing Perforations 
2890' - 2900' 2SPF -

From To Detail of Operations In Sequence and Remarks' 
Rig Number: Key 6052 

6:30 7:00 0.5 Check pressures, started equip. PJSM 

7:00 8:30 1.5 Spot in RU KLX WL. 

RIH wI 1-11/16" tubing perf gun. Located packer top .PUH and perforated In the middle of bottom joint of 3-1/2" tubing above SA @ 2798'. POOH 

8:30 9:30 1.0 ROWL. 

RU hot oiler to tubing. Circulated hole wI 120 bbls of fresh water @ 120 degrees displacing condensate to FB tank. Color cut FB tank - 95 bbls of 

9:30 10:30 1.0 condensate returned on circulation. 

10:30 11:30 1.0 RO hot oiler. NO tree, NU BOPE. RU floor and tools. Install seal-lock tubing pup into hanger wI TIW valve. 

PU and unlanded tubing hanger fl head. String 22k. PU to 60k. Work tubing trying to get SA movement. Streatch calculation shows stuck @ SA. PU 

on tubing to a maximum of SOK. Worked and Jarred on tubing string gaining no movement on tubing. PU and attempted to rotate tubing string 

several times (maximum torque of 2200 It Ibs) wI PU wt's from 22k to 30k -gain 1 round before max torque. PU on tubing to 70k and let hang In 

elevators 1/2 hr. worked tubing 3 more times fl neutral to 70k. No gain in tubing movement. Landed hanger in head. Closed pipe rams on tubing 

11:30 14:30 3.0 pup. SISW, SOFO. Walt on chemical cutter to be hot shotted to RS. 

Total Hours: a.o 

Daily Cost: $ 6,420 Total Cost: $ 17,687 

··~.i·~:'~' . 
RECEIVED 

MAY ijlj 2016 

ON. OFOIL, GAS & MINING 
~i: 

'it.,' _' 

DailyOperations Report OffESEN
Workover

**'

Operation Well Name Report Date Casing Size Tubing Size Foreman Day
x Workover CoalvilleGas Storage 12 5/6/2016 7" 20# K-55 3-1/2" 9.3# N-80

S. Colvin 3Repair 9.2# J-55

Plug & Abandon SICP SITP 7" x 9-5/8" FTP Formation PBTD TD W.O. AFE$ AFE

O 0 5 Long Wall SS 2,995 3,060 114,550 55140

New Perforations 6-Ô -Sþ Existing Perforations
2890' - 2900' 2SPF

From To Detall of Operations in Sequence and Remarks:
Rig Number: Key 6052

6:30 7:00 0.5 Check pressures, started equip. PJSM
7:00 8:30 1.5 Spot in RUKLXWL.

RIHw/ 1-11/16" tubingperf gun. Located packer top .PUHand perforated in the middleof bottom joint of 3-1/2" tubing above SA@2798 . POOH
8:30 9:30 1.0 RDWL.

RU hot oiler to tubing. Circulated hole w/ 120 bbis of fresh water @120 degrees displacing condensate to FBtank. Color cut FBtank -95

9:30 10:30 1.0 condensatereturned on circulation.
10:30 11:30 1.0 RD hot oiler. ND tree, NU BOPE. RU floor and tools. Install seal-locktubing pup into hanger w/ TIW valve.

PU and unlanded tubing hanger f/ head. String 22k. PU to 60k. Work tubingtrying to get SA movement.Streatch calculation shows stuck @SA PU
on tubing to a maximum of SOK.Worked and jarred on tubing stringgaining no movement on tubing. PU and attempted to rotate tubing string
several times (maximum torque of 2200 ft Ibs) w/ PU wt's from 22k to 30k -gain 1round before max torque. PU on tubing to 70k and let hang in
elevators1/2 hr. Worked tubing 3 more times f/ neutral to 70k. No gain in tubing movement. Landed hanger in head. Closed pipe rams on tubing

11:30 14:30 3.0 pup. SISW,SDFD.Wait on chemical cutter to be hot shotted to RS.

Total Hours: 8.0

DaHyCost: $ 6,420 Total Cost: $ 17,687

RECEIVED
· MM03 2016

DN.0F0lt,GAS&

DailyOperations Report OffESEN
Workover

**'

Operation Well Name Report Date Casing Size Tubing Size Foreman Day
x Workover CoalvilleGas Storage 12 5/6/2016 7" 20# K-55 3-1/2" 9.3# N-80

S. Colvin 3Repair 9.2# J-55

Plug & Abandon SICP SITP 7" x 9-5/8" FTP Formation PBTD TD W.O. AFE$ AFE

O 0 5 Long Wall SS 2,995 3,060 114,550 55140

New Perforations 6-Ô -Sþ Existing Perforations
2890' - 2900' 2SPF

From To Detall of Operations in Sequence and Remarks:
Rig Number: Key 6052

6:30 7:00 0.5 Check pressures, started equip. PJSM
7:00 8:30 1.5 Spot in RUKLXWL.

RIHw/ 1-11/16" tubingperf gun. Located packer top .PUHand perforated in the middleof bottom joint of 3-1/2" tubing above SA@2798 . POOH
8:30 9:30 1.0 RDWL.

RU hot oiler to tubing. Circulated hole w/ 120 bbis of fresh water @120 degrees displacing condensate to FBtank. Color cut FBtank -95

9:30 10:30 1.0 condensatereturned on circulation.
10:30 11:30 1.0 RD hot oiler. ND tree, NU BOPE. RU floor and tools. Install seal-locktubing pup into hanger w/ TIW valve.

PU and unlanded tubing hanger f/ head. String 22k. PU to 60k. Work tubingtrying to get SA movement.Streatch calculation shows stuck @SA PU
on tubing to a maximum of SOK.Worked and jarred on tubing stringgaining no movement on tubing. PU and attempted to rotate tubing string
several times (maximum torque of 2200 ft Ibs) w/ PU wt's from 22k to 30k -gain 1round before max torque. PU on tubing to 70k and let hang in
elevators1/2 hr. Worked tubing 3 more times f/ neutral to 70k. No gain in tubing movement. Landed hanger in head. Closed pipe rams on tubing

11:30 14:30 3.0 pup. SISW,SDFD.Wait on chemical cutter to be hot shotted to RS.

Total Hours: 8.0

DaHyCost: $ 6,420 Total Cost: $ 17,687

RECEIVED
· MM03 2016

DN.0F0lt,GAS&



Daily Operations Report 
Workover 
Operation Well Name 

t!- Workover 
Coalville Gas Storage 12 

t- Repair 

t- Plug & Abandon slCP slTP 

° I ° I 

Report Date 

I 5/5/2016 I 
FCP FTP 

I 
New Perforations 'i?-oL/3-36~L/1 

aUEST~R' 
Wexpro 

Casing Size Tubing Size Foreman Day 

7" 20# K-55 I 3-1/2" 9,3# N-80 I 5, Colvin I 2 
9,2#J-55 

Formation PBro TO W.O. AFE $ AFE 

I Long Wall 55 I 2,995 I 3,060 I 114,550 I 55140 

Existing Perforations 
2890' - 2900' 2SPF 

From To Detail of Operations In Sequence and Remarks' 
RlsNumber: Key Energy 6052 

Move rigs equip, to location. Set in all assoc. equip. Set and fill 400 bbl upright tank wI Coalville city water. RU and guy out rig. Run pump line to 
13:00 19:00 6.0 casing outlet. Set in cement returns tank. SDFD 

Total Hours. 6.0 

Daily Cost: $ 4,373 Total Cost: $ 11,267 

I.,' 

RECEIVED 

MAY ~s 2016 

DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING 

DailyOperations Report OffESER
wexpro

Workover
Operation Well Name Report Date Casing Size Tubing Size Foreman Day
x Workover CoalvilleGas Storage 12 5/5/2016 7" 20# K-55 3-1/2" 9.3# N-80

S. Colvin 2Repair 9.2# J-55
Plug & Abandon SICP SITP FCP FTP Formation PBTD TD W.O. AFE$ AFE

0 0 Long Wall SS 2,995 3,060 114,550 55140

New Perforations 464 6 - Existing Perforations
2890' - 2900' 2SPF

From To Detail of Operations in Sequence and Remarks:
RIgNumber: Key Energy 6052

Move rigs equip. to location. Set in all assoc. equip. Set and fill 400 bbl upright tank w/ Coalville city water RUand guy out rig. Run pump line to
13:00 19:00 6.0 casing outlet. Set in cement returns tank. SDFD

Total Hours: 6.0

Daily Cost: $ 4,373 Total Cost: $ 11 267

RECEIVED
MAYM 2016

DN.0F0lL,GAS&

DailyOperations Report OffESER
wexpro

Workover
Operation Well Name Report Date Casing Size Tubing Size Foreman Day
x Workover CoalvilleGas Storage 12 5/5/2016 7" 20# K-55 3-1/2" 9.3# N-80

S. Colvin 2Repair 9.2# J-55
Plug & Abandon SICP SITP FCP FTP Formation PBTD TD W.O. AFE$ AFE

0 0 Long Wall SS 2,995 3,060 114,550 55140

New Perforations 464 6 - Existing Perforations
2890' - 2900' 2SPF

From To Detail of Operations in Sequence and Remarks:
RIgNumber: Key Energy 6052

Move rigs equip. to location. Set in all assoc. equip. Set and fill 400 bbl upright tank w/ Coalville city water RUand guy out rig. Run pump line to
13:00 19:00 6.0 casing outlet. Set in cement returns tank. SDFD

Total Hours: 6.0

Daily Cost: $ 4,373 Total Cost: $ 11 267

RECEIVED
MAYM 2016

DN.0F0lL,GAS&



oJ' .. Pipe Tally Page 1 

Number of good jts 48 Number of jts out __ 0--r"::-r-:-__ _ 
Company GlAb"-.d ely 1 \41 tv \,)' lpoG2l- AFE Date sM Iu, 
Well Name to ,,-h.l\\~ t\..~c-) s\-() ,~C) t ~ l'd- Ch1~w~'II) G.L. K.B. 

Known KB Total KB Height 7 

Description ~?=(?4~'~o-;}tf1 Working height KB and Jewelry 10.9 

Orange numbers are total jts tallied 
Note: Write in blue or shade areas 

1 21 21 41 41 
2 2 II--~~t---.....~o.,...tl 22 22 11--....r~+--ft-~,nii-I142 42 II----;.;:~+_..;...r.;.;..:.;n-II 

3 3 23 23 43 43 
4 4 1I--~"",t--~~T.iM1 24 24 44 44 11--~~+-"';';;~:;.r.J1 
5 5 25 25 45 45 
6 6 II--~~t--""""''';''';'';'T><-II 26 26 46 46 II--~~+-";;;'~~I 

7 27 27 47 4 7 11--~~+_';;";;':;':"oO;-Il 
8 8 11--~~t---.....~~128 28 48 48 
9 9 11--~~t--~~~129 29 II--~~+-~~~I 

10 10 30 30 
11 11 31 31 II--~~+-";";";:;';':';;";""!I 

12 12 32 32 
13 13 33 33 11--~~+-...;.r.;';";""""'1 
14 14 34 34 
15 15 35 35 
16 16 36 36 11--~~+-->M-Tri~1 
17 17 37 37 
18 18 38 38 11--~.;.T-+-....,.,o.-r,io7:-Il 

19 19 39 39 
20 20 40 40 II--~:;";-+-~;;;';;"';";;;.;.....JI 

f---------+-----41 
f-------1I-------f1 

f----------I-----II 
I-------J---~I 

11----+-----------

t 

f----------iI------11 
f-------J-----II 

1--------+-----11 
J----------J----II 
1----------+-----11 

f-------4-----I1 

RECEIVED 

MAY ~9 2016 

DlV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING 

1-------+----
1-------+----

f-----+----
1----------+----

Pipe Tally Page 1

Number of good jts 48 Number of jts out 0
Company \ osa AFE Date B )]p

Well Name G.L. K.B.
Known KB Total KB Height 7

Description So Working height KB and Jewelry 10.9

Orange numbers are totaljts tallied
Note: Write in blue or shade areas

1 1 59.84 70.74 21 21 56.80 1252.12 41 41 58.67 2437.68
2 2 59.32 . 22 22 61.50 17137£ 42 42 58.41
3 3 59.22 . 23 23 59.36 43 43 59.77
4 4 59.12 4 .4 24 24 58.80 44 44 59.61 2BTET
s 5 59.80 . 25 25 59.90 45 45

¯
5 T8

6 6 59.90 . 26 26 59.95 4e 46 58.86
7 58.53 . 27 27 57.85 47 47 30.81

e 8 58.61 . 2e 28 58.64 4e 48 30.66
e 9 58.32 . 2e 29 59.11

¯T/2725
10 10 59.90 . 30 30 59.76

¯fiBBW
91 11 58.74 . as 31 59.95

¯TBIBM
12 12 . 1 . 32 32
13 13 58.86 . as 33 59.68 f§65X
14 14 57.32 . 24 34

¯2023¾

15 15 5 .89 . 35 35 60.50 žõB4X
1e 16 6 .5 . 36 36 59.27 ŽT415T
o 17 58.77 . 37 37 58.84 TÏÖ2X
1e 18 59. 0 . 38 38 58.94 226T2
is 19 59.74 . 39 39 59.28

TJ2D¯BT
20 20 59.45 . 40

4. 1183.69 415.07

RECEIVED
MAY492016

DIVOFOlL,GAS&

Pipe Tally Page 1

Number of good jts 48 Number of jts out 0
Company \ osa AFE Date B )]p

Well Name G.L. K.B.
Known KB Total KB Height 7

Description So Working height KB and Jewelry 10.9

Orange numbers are totaljts tallied
Note: Write in blue or shade areas

1 1 59.84 70.74 21 21 56.80 1252.12 41 41 58.67 2437.68
2 2 59.32 . 22 22 61.50 17137£ 42 42 58.41
3 3 59.22 . 23 23 59.36 43 43 59.77
4 4 59.12 4 .4 24 24 58.80 44 44 59.61 2BTET
s 5 59.80 . 25 25 59.90 45 45

¯
5 T8

6 6 59.90 . 26 26 59.95 4e 46 58.86
7 58.53 . 27 27 57.85 47 47 30.81

e 8 58.61 . 2e 28 58.64 4e 48 30.66
e 9 58.32 . 2e 29 59.11

¯T/2725
10 10 59.90 . 30 30 59.76

¯fiBBW
91 11 58.74 . as 31 59.95

¯TBIBM
12 12 . 1 . 32 32
13 13 58.86 . as 33 59.68 f§65X
14 14 57.32 . 24 34

¯2023¾

15 15 5 .89 . 35 35 60.50 žõB4X
1e 16 6 .5 . 36 36 59.27 ŽT415T
o 17 58.77 . 37 37 58.84 TÏÖ2X
1e 18 59. 0 . 38 38 58.94 226T2
is 19 59.74 . 39 39 59.28

TJ2D¯BT
20 20 59.45 . 40

4. 1183.69 415.07

RECEIVED
MAY492016

DIVOFOlL,GAS&



RECEIVED: Jun. 20, 2016

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Storage Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 COALVILLE GAS STORAGE 12 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QUESTAR PIPELINE COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43043302490000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 P.O.Box 45360 , Salt Lake city , UT, 84145 801 324-5061  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 COALVILLE GAS STORAGE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2170 FSL 1449 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 09 Township: 02.0N Range: 05.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 SUMMIT 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

5 /13 /2016

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Coalville 12 was P&A as per attached documentation. Please find
attached a copy of the final report + updated WBD.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Jacob Isaac K. Abraham 801 324-3160

TITLE
 Associate Engineer - Reservoir

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 6 /20 /2016

June 20, 2016

Sundry Number: 72450 API Well Number: 43043302490000Sundry Number: 72450 API Well Number: 43043302490000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Storage Well COALVILLEGAS STORAGE 12

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR PIPELINECOMPANY 43043302490000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O.Box 45360 , Salt Lake city , UT, 84145 801 324-5061 Ext COALVILLEGAS STORAGE

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SUMMIT

2170 FSL 1449 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWSE Section: 09 Township: 02.0N Range: 05.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

5/13/2016
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Coalville 12 was P&A as per attached documentation. Please find Accepted by the
attached a copy of the final report + updated WBD. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
June 20, 2016

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jacob Isaac K. Abraham 801 324-3160 Associate Engineer - Reservoir

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 6/20/2016

RECEIVED: Jun. 20,



RECEIVED: Jun. 20, 2016

 
 

 

Questar Pipeline Company 
333 South State Street 
P.O. Box 45360 
Salt Lake City, UT 84145 
Tel (801) 324-3160 
Fax (801) 324-5606 

 
 

Coalville Gas Storage 12 
API 43-043-30249 

Plugging Procedure 

1. Operations began on 5/2/2016 and ended on 5/13/2016. 

2. Plugging procedures witnessed by Lisha Cordova of the Utah DOGM Office. 

3. Set CICR @ 2,802’. 

4. Tested the casing to 1,060 psi for 10 minutes, no pressure lost. 

5. Could not established injection rate. 

Cement Plug 

6. Mixed and laid 40 sks “G” cement balanced cement plug from 2,595’ up to 2,795’. 

Poz Spacer 

7. Mixed and pumped balanced 40 bbl 9.0# Poz Gel spacer from 2,555’ up to 1,580’. 

Cement Plug 

8. Mixed and laid in a 25 sk “G” cement balanced cement plug from 1,580’ up to 1,454’. 

9. Tagged cement at 1,434’. 

Poz Spacer 

10. Mixed and pumped balanced 36 bbl 9.0# Poz Gel spacer from 1,434’ to 543’. 

Cement Plug 

11. Mixed and laid in a 25 sk “G” cement balanced cement plug from 543’ up to 418’. 

12. Tagged cement top @ 441’. 

Poz Spacer 

13. Mixed and pumped balanced 11 bbl 9.0# Poz Gel spacer from 400’ to 125’. 

14. Perforated csg from 125’ – 126’ 4SPF. 

15. Unable to establish circulation down 7” casing and up 7” x 9-5/8” annulus. 

Sundry Number: 72450 API Well Number: 43043302490000Sundry Number: 72450 API Well Number: 43043302490000

OtlESTAN -

- - Questar Pipeline Company
333 South State Street
P.O. Box 45360
Salt Lake City, UT 84145
Tel (801) 324-3160
Fax (801) 324-5606

Coalville Gas Storage 12
API 43-043-30249

Plugging Procedure

1. Operations began on 5/2/2016 and ended on 5/13/2016.

2. Plugging procedures witnessed by Lisha Cordova of the Utah DOGM Office.

3. Set CICR @ 2,802'.

4. Tested the casing to 1,060 psi for 10 minutes, no pressure lost.

5. Could not established injection rate.

Cement Plug

6. Mixed and laid 40 sks "G" cement balanced cement plug from 2,595' up to 2,795'.

Poz Spacer

7. Mixed and pumped balanced 40 bbl 9.0# Poz Gel spacer from 2,555' up to 1,580'.

Cement Plug

8. Mixed and laid in a 25 sk "G" cement balanced cement plug from 1,580' up to 1,454'.

9. Tagged cement at 1,434'.

Poz Spacer

10. Mixed and pumped balanced 36 bbl 9.0# Poz Gel spacer from 1,434' to 543'.

Cement Plug

11. Mixed and laid in a 25 sk "G" cement balanced cement plug from 543' up to 418'.

12. Tagged cement top @ 441'.

Poz Spacer

13. Mixed and pumped balanced 11 bbl 9.0# Poz Gel spacer from 400' to 125'.

14. Perforated csg from 125' -126' 4SPF.

15. Unable to establish circulation down 7" casing and up 7" x 9-5/8" annulus.

RECEIVED: Jun. 20,



RECEIVED: Jun. 20, 2016

Cement Plug 

16. Mixed and laid in a 33 sk “G” cement balanced cement plug from 183’ up to surface. 

Cement At Surface 

17. Mixed and pumped 307 sk “G” cement down 4-1/2” csg with returns up the 4-1/2” x 9-5/8” annulus. 

Cement returns to surface. 

Cement At Surface 

18. Dig out around WH, cut off guy line anchors below GL. 

19. Cutoff casing 3’ below GL. 

20. Cement down 7’ in 7” casing below cutoff level. Cement down 2-1/2” in 7” x 9-5/8” annulus. 

21.  Top off with 3 sks cement. 

22. Weld regulation dry hole marker plate onto top of 9-5/8” csg 4' below ground level. 

23. Back fill hole. 

24. Will reclaim at a later time. 

25. GPS Coordinates: 

• Latitude: 40.920327° 

• Longitude -111.383328° 

Sundry Number: 72450 API Well Number: 43043302490000Sundry Number: 72450 API Well Number: 43043302490000

Cement Plug

16. Mixed and laid in a 33 sk "G" cement balanced cement plug from 183' up to surface.

Cement At Surface

17. Mixed and pumped 307 sk "G" cement down 4-1/2" csg with returns up the 4-1/2" x 9-5/8" annulus.

Cement returns to surface.

Cement At Surface

18. Dig out around WH, cut off guy line anchors below GL.

19. Cutoff casing 3' below GL.

20. Cement down 7' in 7" casing below cutoff level. Cement down 2-1/2" in 7" x 9-5/8" annulus.

21. Top off with 3 sks cement.

22. Weld regulation dry hole marker plate onto top of 9-5/8" csg 4' below ground level.

23. Back fill hole.

24. Will reclaim at a later time.

25. GPS Coordinates:

• Latitude: 40.920327°

• Longitude -111.383328°

RECEIVED: Jun. 20,



RECEIVED: Jun. 20, 2016

Daily	Operations	Report
Wellbore	Diagram

11.71' 25

Squezze perfs 4 spf @ 125', Could not pump into.

35 sks Neat "G" cement f/ 183' to surface inside 7''.

6 sks 9.1#  Poz‐gel slurry(8 bbls). 183'‐ 385' 

25 sks Neat "G" cement 441' to 543' inside 7''‐Tagged.

17‐1/2" Hole 13‐3/8", 54.5#, K‐55 Csg @ 510.60'

Cement to surface.  600 sks

21 sks (40 bbls) of Poz‐gel mixed @ 9.1 ppg 543'‐1,419'

25 sk (4.1 bbls) 15.8 ppg ‐ 16.2# "Neat G" cement plug 1434' to 1580' kbm

Tagged plug w/ 5k down.

12‐1/4" Hole 9‐5/8", 36#, K‐55 Csg @ 1531.99'

Cement to surface.  730 sks

22 sks (40 bbls) of Poz‐gel mixed @ 9.1 ppg

975' of spacer 1580 ‐ 2595'

40 sks (8.1 bbls) 15.9 ppg "Neat G" 200' cement plug above CICR 2595‐2795' kbm

Baker CICR set @ 5‐7‐16 2795' WLM. Could not pump thru.

Cut off tubing 6' above packer top @ 2800' WLM

Seal Assy @ 2816.37'

8k Compression Otis Pkr @ 2806'

2.75" X Nipple @ 2823.17'

Perforated tubing pup above "PXN" plug.

2.75" X Nipple @ 2830.08'

9.2# is Seal Lock (above pkr) 3‐1/2", 9.2# N‐80, 9.3# J‐55 Tbg @ 2837.85'

Long Wall SS 2890' ‐ 2900' 2SPF

7", 20#, K‐55 Csg @ 3048.10'

PBTD @ 2995' Cement to surface. 600 sks

8‐3/4" Hole TD @ 3060'

Well Name: Coalville Gas Storage 12 KB Elev. 5631.60'

County, State Summit, UT

Legal Description: NWSE 9‐2N‐5S
API: 43‐043‐30249

SHL: 2170' FSL, 1449' FEL GR Elev. 5617.00'

Updated By: Scott Colvin

Date Updated: 5/13/2016

Spud Date: 12/10/1983

TD Date: 1/9/1984

Well TD: 3,060

Orientation: Vertical

Plug Back MD: 25'

Bridge Plug MD:

As of PTA 5/13/2016

All measurements are in KB 

unless otherwise specified.

Injecting Frac Jobs: 1

Latitude 40.92037
Longitude ‐111.3833
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Sundry Number: 72450 API Well Number: 43043302490000Sundry Number: 72450 API Well Number: 43043302490000

Daily Operations Report GUESTAR
VVexpro

Wellbore Diagram
Well Name: Coalville Gas Storage 12 KB Elev. 5631.60'

County, State Summit, UT
Legal Description: NWSE 9-2N-5S 11.71' 25
API: 43-043-30249

SHL: 2170' FSL, 1449' FEL GR Elev. 5617.00'

Updated By: Scott Colvin
Date Updated: 5/13/2016 Squezze perfs4 spf @ 125, Could not pump into.

Spud Date: 12/10/1983 35 sks Neat "G" cement f/ 183 to surface inside 7 .

TD Date: 1/9/1984
Well TD: 3,060 6 sks 9.1# Poz-gel slurry(8 bb\s). 183 -385'

Orientation: Vertical
Plug Back MD: 25' 25 sks Neat "G" cement 441 to 543 inside 7 Tagged.

Bridge Plug MD: 17-1/2" HoleÀ g 13-3/8", 54.5#, K-55 csg@ 510.60'

Injecting Frac Jobs: 1 Cementtosurface. 600sks

Latitude 40.92037
Longitude -111.3833

As of PTA 5/13/2016

AIImeasurements are in KB

unless otherwise specified. 21sks (40 bb\s) of Poz-gel mixed @ 9.1 ppg 543-1,419
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25 sk (4.1 bb\s) 15.8 ppg -16.2# "Neat G" cement plug 1434 to 1580 kbm
Tagged plug w/ 5k down.

12-1/4" Hole 9-5/8", 36#, K-55 Csg @ 1531.99

Cement to surface. 730 sks

22 sks (40 bb\s) of Poz-gel mixed @ 9.1 ppg
975 ofspacer1580-2595

i 40 sks (8.1 bb\s) 15.9 ppg "Neat G" 200 cement plug above CICR 2595-2795 kbm

Baker CICR set @ 5-7-16 2795 WLM. Could not pump thru.

Cut off tubing 6 above packer top @ 2800 WLM

Seal Assy @ 2816.37

Sk Compression Otis Pkr @ 2806

2.75" X Nipple @ 2823.17

Perforatedtubingpupabove"PXN"plug.

2.75" X Nipple @ 2830.08

9.2# is Seal Lock (above pkr) 3-1/2", 9.2# N-80, 9.3# J-55 Tbg @ 2837.85

Long Wall SS 2890 -2900 2SPF

7", 20#, K-55 Csg @ 3048.10

PBTD @ 2995 Cementto surface. 600 sks
8-3/4" Hole TD @ 3060

RECEIVED: Jun. 20,
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