
Form OGC-la ' SUBMIT IN TTtIPLICATE*

,
STATE OF UTAH (Other instructions on

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
reverse side)

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

Fee

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL, DEEPEN, OR PLUG BACK 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

la. Type of Work 7. Unit Agreement Name
DRILL DEEPEN PLUG BACK

b. Type of Well
OW

11 ell Other
Sinnale ultiple 8. Farm or Lease Name

2. Name of Operator
-

Chamnlin 372 Amoco "C"
Amoco Production Company yg

3. Address of Operator
L

P.O. Box 17675, Salt Lake City UT 84117 10. Meld and Yool, or WHdca

4. catiof cof Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*)

Sec. 23, 866.1' FNL & 527.3' FWL " Ì'siveÌ'oir°e'aBlk.

'°Ñ,
& 1320' FWl, Sec. 23, TAN, R7E

14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parrish 13. State

Approximately 4 miles Southeast of Castle Rock, Utah Sunnit Utah
15. Distance from proposed* 16. No. of acres in lease 17. No. of acres assigned

location to nearest to this well
property or lease line, ft. 527. 3
(Also to nearest drlg. line, if any)

18. Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed depth 20. Rotary or cable tools
to nearest well, drilling, completed,
or applied for, on this lease, ft 8 , 10 '

) y Rotary
21. Elevations (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 22. Approx. date work will start*

7012 ' Top of Hub When approved
23 PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

Size of Hole Size of Casing Weight per Foot Setting Depth Quantity of Cement

12 1/4" 9 5/8" 32.3# 1600' 1400 sx
8 3/4" 7" * * 2000 sx

APPRO

eD

BY T

EæD ISa t

OF OIL, GAS, AND MîNINGPropose to Develop Twin Creek Reserves JUL () 8 198

DATE: ¶-- ¶- 70 (See Attachments)

01, GAS & MINING

Said well will be drilled in accordance with the application filed
in Cause #183-1

IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM: If proposal is to deepen or plug back, give data on present productive zone and proposed new pro-

ductive zone. If proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give pertinent data on subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths. Give blowout

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Permit No. ...
........ Approval Date .

Approved by................. ....... . . . Title... ........ Date

Conditions of approval, if any:

*See Instructions On Reverse
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T 4N R 7 NE Corner
NWCorner N 89°32'l E 5033.03'
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_ _ _

CHAMPLIN 372
. 527.3' AMOCO"C" WELL#2

I SCALE:1" = 1000'

I e Found Brass Cap
El Found Stone
CDSet Brass Cap

..
I - (3 Found Stone -

I Set Brass Cap
o Hub and Tack

SW Corner SE Corner

I, John A. Proffit of Evanston, W.yoming certif.y that in accordance with

a request from R.C. Buckley of Evanston, Wyoming ÿç, Amoco

Production Company - I made a survey on the 23rd da.y of June ,
1990

_for

Location and Elevation of the Champlin 372 Amoco "C" Well #2 as shown on the above

map, the wellsite is in the NW¼ of Section 23
, Townshig 4N

Range 7E of the Salt Lake .Base &
Meridian Summit County, State of Utah .

Elevation is 7012 Feet Top of Hub Datum U.S.G.S. Quad - Castle Rock,'

litah, NEkSE¼ Section 22, T4N, R7E, Spot Elevation - 7061'

Reference point NORTH 300' TOP OF SPIKE ELEVATION-7023.2'

Reference point EAST 300' TOP OF SPIKE _ELEVATION 6985.4'

Reference point
__

_EAST 500' TOP OF SPIKE ELEVATION 7005.9'

Reference point EAST 570' TOP OF SPIKE ELEVATION 7035.4'

JOHN.Af |ROFFIT AH R.LI.S. 190. 2860

DATE: June 25, 1980 UINTA ENGINEERING& SURVEYING,INC.

JOB NO-: 79-10-87 ' 808 MAINSTREET, EVANSTON,

T 4N R 7 NE Corner
NWCorner N 89°32'l E 5033.03'

o
_ _ _

CHAMPLIN 372
. 527.3' AMOCO"C" WELL#2

I SCALE:1" = 1000'

I e Found Brass Cap
El Found Stone
CDSet Brass Cap

..
I - (3 Found Stone -

I Set Brass Cap
o Hub and Tack

SW Corner SE Corner

I, John A. Proffit of Evanston, W.yoming certif.y that in accordance with

a request from R.C. Buckley of Evanston, Wyoming ÿç, Amoco

Production Company - I made a survey on the 23rd da.y of June ,
1990

_for

Location and Elevation of the Champlin 372 Amoco "C" Well #2 as shown on the above

map, the wellsite is in the NW¼ of Section 23
, Townshig 4N

Range 7E of the Salt Lake .Base &
Meridian Summit County, State of Utah .

Elevation is 7012 Feet Top of Hub Datum U.S.G.S. Quad - Castle Rock,'

litah, NEkSE¼ Section 22, T4N, R7E, Spot Elevation - 7061'

Reference point NORTH 300' TOP OF SPIKE ELEVATION-7023.2'

Reference point EAST 300' TOP OF SPIKE _ELEVATION 6985.4'

Reference point
__

_EAST 500' TOP OF SPIKE ELEVATION 7005.9'

Reference point EAST 570' TOP OF SPIKE ELEVATION 7035.4'

JOHN.Af |ROFFIT AH R.LI.S. 190. 2860

DATE: June 25, 1980 UINTA ENGINEERING& SURVEYING,INC.

JOB NO-: 79-10-87 ' 808 MAINSTREET, EVANSTON,



Tool Amoco
Pur).iers Company
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= Shows permanent production equipment to be installed af Ler drilling rig has moved out.

- -= Dotted lines indicated perimeter of leveled location.

The fenced pit used for production will V covered if any f3uid .is present. The dril3i

and production pads will be constructed with doxers and graders using native material.
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LOCATION P,0.Eox17675 EXHIBlT"l)"
SALT SKE CITY, UTAL M.l_17
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Form OGC-1b SUBMW N TRIPLICATE*

ATE OF UTAH (Ot .structions on
reverse side)

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING s. r.saan nESIGNATION AND SBRMI. NO.

Fee
SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS

8. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEM OB TRIBE NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
OW

LL
WABLL O 42...

2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

Amoco Production Company Champlin 372 Amoco "C"
8. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

P.O. Box 17675, Salt Lake City, UT 84117 #1
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requiremente.* 10, FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
At surface ADSchutz Ranch

11. mac.,T., a., x., omar.x. Axe

NW/4 Sec. 23, 866.1' FNL 6e 527.3' FWL
senvar on anna

Sec. 23, TAN, R7E
14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONs (Show whether or, nT, on, sto.) 12. CooNTY om razzan 18. swara

7012 ' Top of Hub Sumiit Utah
1e· CheckAppropnate BoxToindicate Nature of Notice, Report,or OtherData

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO : BUBBBQUENT REPORT OF :

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PUI.L OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

PRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CAalNO

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* BHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANs (Other)
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel

(Other) ('ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)
17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state n11 pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this Work.) *

This is to advise that the name of the subject well has been changed
from Champlin 372 Amoco "C" #2 to Champlin 372 Amoco "C" #1.

The drilling unit for this well has been designated as the W/2 of
Section 23. (Stand up)

18. I hpreby certify that the for oing i tr e and correct

SIGNED 9 TITLE DATE
8-7-80

(This space for Federal or State ofBee use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse
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ATTACHMENTTO FDRMOGC-la

Champlin 372 Amoco "C" #2

1. Geologic name of the surface formation: Tertiary

2. Estimated tops of geological markers:

Preuss Salt 6255'-6330'
Twin Creek 6365'
Nugget 7880'

3. Estimated depth anticipated to encounter water, oil, gas or other
mineral-bearing formations:

Water, Oil, and Gas anticipated at: See Item #2

4. Casing Program: See Item #23, Form OGC-la
Distributed as Follows:

Size of Hole: Size of Casing: Weight/Grade: Condition: Depth:

12 1/4" 9 5/8" 32.3# ST&C New 1600'

8 3/4" 7" 26# K-55 ST&C New 200'
" 23# K-55 ST&C New 5855'
" 26# S-95 LT&C New 500'
" 26# K-55 ST&C New 1770'

Tubing:
2 7/8" 6.5# J-55 ECE New 8100'

5. Operators minimum specifications for pressure control equipment are
shown on the attached schematic diagrams. Testing of such is to be
performed daily and noted on the IADC Daily Drilling Report. After
running surface casing and prior to drilling out, BOP and other
pressure equipment will be tested to the full working pressure rating
as shown on the attached diagram. Thereafter, the BOP will be
checked daily for mechanical operations only and will be noted on
the IADC Daily Drilling Report.

6. Mud Program:

0 - 1500' Nativelixl 8.3-8.5 #/gal.

1500' - TD Low solid, non-dispersed, 8.5-9.0

ATTACHMENTTO FDRMOGC-la

Champlin 372 Amoco "C" #2

1. Geologic name of the surface formation: Tertiary

2. Estimated tops of geological markers:

Preuss Salt 6255'-6330'
Twin Creek 6365'
Nugget 7880'

3. Estimated depth anticipated to encounter water, oil, gas or other
mineral-bearing formations:

Water, Oil, and Gas anticipated at: See Item #2

4. Casing Program: See Item #23, Form OGC-la
Distributed as Follows:

Size of Hole: Size of Casing: Weight/Grade: Condition: Depth:

12 1/4" 9 5/8" 32.3# ST&C New 1600'

8 3/4" 7" 26# K-55 ST&C New 200'
" 23# K-55 ST&C New 5855'
" 26# S-95 LT&C New 500'
" 26# K-55 ST&C New 1770'

Tubing:
2 7/8" 6.5# J-55 ECE New 8100'

5. Operators minimum specifications for pressure control equipment are
shown on the attached schematic diagrams. Testing of such is to be
performed daily and noted on the IADC Daily Drilling Report. After
running surface casing and prior to drilling out, BOP and other
pressure equipment will be tested to the full working pressure rating
as shown on the attached diagram. Thereafter, the BOP will be
checked daily for mechanical operations only and will be noted on
the IADC Daily Drilling Report.

6. Mud Program:

0 - 1500' Nativelixl 8.3-8.5 #/gal.

1500' - TD Low solid, non-dispersed, 8.5-9.0



ATTACHMENTTO FORMOGC-la
Champlin 372 Amoco "C" #2
Page Two

T. Auxiliary Equipment :

Kelly cock, floor sub with full opening valve. 3" choke
manifold with remote control choke. Two-man mud logger
fran surface - TD.

8. Testing Program:

No special tests are planned.

Logging Program:

Linear DIL w/GR* Base of surface casing - TD
Dual Laterolog** Base of surface casing - TD
CNL-FDCw/GR-Cal. Over zones of interest
Dipmeter 6265' - TD
BHC Sonic w/GR-Cal Base of surface casing - TD
GR . 0 - 2000'
*If mud is fresh
** If mud is salty

Coring Program:

None

Stimulation Program:

To be determined by District Office upon completion of drilling
operations.

9. No abnormal pressures, temperatures, or hydrogen sulfide gas is
anticipated.

10. Anticipated starting date will be when approved and the duration
of operations will be approximately 60 days.

ATTACHMENTTO FORMOGC-la
Champlin 372 Amoco "C" #2
Page Two

T. Auxiliary Equipment :

Kelly cock, floor sub with full opening valve. 3" choke
manifold with remote control choke. Two-man mud logger
fran surface - TD.

8. Testing Program:

No special tests are planned.

Logging Program:

Linear DIL w/GR* Base of surface casing - TD
Dual Laterolog** Base of surface casing - TD
CNL-FDCw/GR-Cal. Over zones of interest
Dipmeter 6265' - TD
BHC Sonic w/GR-Cal Base of surface casing - TD
GR . 0 - 2000'
*If mud is fresh
** If mud is salty

Coring Program:

None

Stimulation Program:

To be determined by District Office upon completion of drilling
operations.

9. No abnormal pressures, temperatures, or hydrogen sulfide gas is
anticipated.

10. Anticipated starting date will be when approved and the duration
of operations will be approximately 60 days.
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August 8, 1980

Amoco Production Company
P.O. Box 17675
Salt Lake City, Utah 34117

RE: Well No. Champlin 372, Amoco "C" #2
Sec. 23, T. 4N, R. 7E
Summit County, Utah

Insofar as this office is concerned, approval to drill the above
referred to oil well is hereby granted in accordance with the Order issued
in Cause No. 183-1 dated July 26, 1979.

Should you determine that it will be necessary to plug and abandon
this well, you are hereby requested to immediategy notify the following:

MICHAEL T. MINDER - Petroleum Engineer
HOME: 876-3001
OFFICE: $$$-$$$1

Enclosed please find Form OUC-8-X, which is to be completed whether
or not water aands (aquifera) are encountered during drilling. Your
cooperation in completing this form will be appreciated.

Further, it is requested that this Division be notified within 24
hours after drilling operations commence, and that the drilling contractor
and rig number be identified.

The API number assigned to this well is Champlin 372, Amoco "C" #27
43-043-30143.

Sincerely,

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND HINING

Michael T. Minder
Petroleum Engineer

/bh

August 8, 1980

Amoco Production Company
P.O. Box 17675
Salt Lake City, Utah 34117

RE: Well No. Champlin 372, Amoco "C" #2
Sec. 23, T. 4N, R. 7E
Summit County, Utah

Insofar as this office is concerned, approval to drill the above
referred to oil well is hereby granted in accordance with the Order issued
in Cause No. 183-1 dated July 26, 1979.

Should you determine that it will be necessary to plug and abandon
this well, you are hereby requested to immediategy notify the following:

MICHAEL T. MINDER - Petroleum Engineer
HOME: 876-3001
OFFICE: $$$-$$$1

Enclosed please find Form OUC-8-X, which is to be completed whether
or not water aands (aquifera) are encountered during drilling. Your
cooperation in completing this form will be appreciated.

Further, it is requested that this Division be notified within 24
hours after drilling operations commence, and that the drilling contractor
and rig number be identified.

The API number assigned to this well is Champlin 372, Amoco "C" #27
43-043-30143.

Sincerely,

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND HINING

Michael T. Minder
Petroleum Engineer

/bh



DIVISIONOFOILGASANDMINING

SPUDDINGINFORMATION

M OFWW: Amoco Production Company

gg g Champlin 372 Amoco C #1

SECTION 23 NW NW TOWNSHIP 4N RANGE 7E COUNTYsummit

Exeter Drilling

RIG# 23

SPUDDED:DATE 6/12/6°

TIMF 8:30 a.m.

BOW rotary

DRILLINGWILLC0l‡\ENCE ASAP

REPORTEDBY Gordon Fowler

TELEPHONE# 307-789-2591

DATF August 12, 1980 SIGNED '

DIVISIONOFOILGASANDMINING

SPUDDINGINFORMATION

M OFWW: Amoco Production Company

gg g Champlin 372 Amoco C #1

SECTION 23 NW NW TOWNSHIP 4N RANGE 7E COUNTYsummit

Exeter Drilling

RIG# 23

SPUDDED:DATE 6/12/6°

TIMF 8:30 a.m.

BOW rotary

DRILLINGWILLC0l‡\ENCE ASAP

REPORTEDBY Gordon Fowler

TELEPHONE# 307-789-2591

DATF August 12, 1980 SIGNED '



A DIVISION OF WPC, INC.
PET F¯: s¯¯:

L E l_I I¯·1 I~i N A ' Ÿ T I C i¯I L_ L_ I -I B CI RF ' OR 'r' "-R I¯ R '•.-' I DE
- P.O. BOX 552 :+-24 HOUR PHONE 207/2. -1616

CASPER., WYOMING 82602 g.
AIR MONITORING SRMPLE NO. . . 4293
COMPLETE GAS 5ERVICE
CONSULTING CHEMISTS
POLLUTION CONTROL
WATER ANALYSIS DATE RUli· 11/12/80

A 5RMPLE OF: WRTER FROM AMOCO PRODUCTION COMPANY .

'

SAMPLE FROM: CHRMPLIN 372 C-1
AT:.......... .......... ..... .......... SECURED BY:...
SAMPLING CONDITIONS:... .. PRESS:.. .. TEMP:...... TIME:...... DATE:...

I---IFI TER FI N FI L_ VS I E

DISSOLVED SOLIDS OTHER PROPERTIES

CATIONS MG/L ME/L PH 4.2
RESISTIVITY<OHM-METERS>, 77 F . 074

50DIUM-NA 10761.62 468.13
POTA55IUM-K 2700 69.12
CALCIUM-CA 72720 2628. 73 s- pr .

MRGNESIUM-MG 4410 362. 5
BARIUM-BA O 0
TOTAL CATIONS 90591.62 4528.48

ANIONS

CHLORIDE-CL 160000 4512
SULFATE-504 725 15. 08 MN NG
CARBONATE-CO2 0 0
BICARBONATE-HCO2 85. 4 1. 4
TOTAL ANIONS 160810. 4 4528. 48

IRON-FE (TOTAL) 0
TOTAL DISSOLVED SOLIDS(CRLC. > SULFIDE AS H25 0

251402.02

WATER PATTERNS--ME/L
LOGARITHMIC
10000 1000 100 10 1 10 100 1000 10000

I I i I i I i i i

10000 1000 100 10 1 10 100 1000 10000
REMARKS RND RECOMMENDATIONS:

COPIES TO:

RNALYSIS BY:

GL MD

A DIVISION OF WPC, INC.
PET F¯: s¯¯:

L E l_I I¯·1 I~i N A ' Ÿ T I C i¯I L_ L_ I -I B CI RF ' OR 'r' "-R I¯ R '•.-' I DE
- P.O. BOX 552 :+-24 HOUR PHONE 207/2. -1616

CASPER., WYOMING 82602 g.
AIR MONITORING SRMPLE NO. . . 4293
COMPLETE GAS 5ERVICE
CONSULTING CHEMISTS
POLLUTION CONTROL
WATER ANALYSIS DATE RUli· 11/12/80

A 5RMPLE OF: WRTER FROM AMOCO PRODUCTION COMPANY .

'

SAMPLE FROM: CHRMPLIN 372 C-1
AT:.......... .......... ..... .......... SECURED BY:...
SAMPLING CONDITIONS:... .. PRESS:.. .. TEMP:...... TIME:...... DATE:...

I---IFI TER FI N FI L_ VS I E

DISSOLVED SOLIDS OTHER PROPERTIES

CATIONS MG/L ME/L PH 4.2
RESISTIVITY<OHM-METERS>, 77 F . 074

50DIUM-NA 10761.62 468.13
POTA55IUM-K 2700 69.12
CALCIUM-CA 72720 2628. 73 s- pr .

MRGNESIUM-MG 4410 362. 5
BARIUM-BA O 0
TOTAL CATIONS 90591.62 4528.48

ANIONS

CHLORIDE-CL 160000 4512
SULFATE-504 725 15. 08 MN NG
CARBONATE-CO2 0 0
BICARBONATE-HCO2 85. 4 1. 4
TOTAL ANIONS 160810. 4 4528. 48

IRON-FE (TOTAL) 0
TOTAL DISSOLVED SOLIDS(CRLC. > SULFIDE AS H25 0

251402.02

WATER PATTERNS--ME/L
LOGARITHMIC
10000 1000 100 10 1 10 100 1000 10000

I I i I i I i i i

10000 1000 100 10 1 10 100 1000 10000
REMARKS RND RECOMMENDATIONS:

COPIES TO:

RNALYSIS BY:

GL MD



P DIVI5ION OF WPC.. INC.
PETR'OLEUÞ1 ANA v'T I CAL LF¯iBORF ORY SER"-.-' I CE

P.O. BOX 2652 =+:24 HOUR PHONE 307/266-1616
CA5PER, WYOMING 82602

AIR MONITORING SAMPLE NO. . . 4291
COMPLETE GAS SERVICE
CONSULTING CHEMISTS
POLLUTION CONTROL
WATER ANALYSIS vHIE 8:UN: 11.712.80

A SAMPLE OF: WATER FROM AMOCO PRODUCTION CO.
SAMPLE FROM: CHAMPLIN 272 C-1 SHUT IN 11/9/80
AT:... .. SECURED BY:...
SRMPLING CONDITIONS:... .. PRESS:... .. TEMP:...... TIME:...... DATE:...

L--lATER ANALŸS I S

DISSOLVED SOLIDS OTHER PROPERTIES

CATIONS MG/L ME/L PH 4.2
RESISTIVITY<0HM-METERS), 77 F .071

SODIUM-NA 13208.83 574.58
POTASSIÚM-K 2590 66.3
CALCIUM-CA 78376 2910.96
MAGNESIUM-MG 2450 201.39
BARIUM-BA O O
TOTRL CATIONE 96624. 82 4752. 24

ANIONS
4

CHLORIDE-CL 168000 4737.6
SULFATE-504 675 14.04
CARBONATE-CO3 0 0
BICARBONATE-HCO3 97.6 1.6
TOTAL ANIONS 168772.6 4753.24

IRON-FE <TOTAL> O
TOTAL DISSOLVED 50LIDS(CALC.) SULFIDE AS H25 0

265397.43

WRTER PRTTERNG--ME/L
LOGARITHMIC
10000 1000 100 10 1 10 100 1000 10000

-BA
-+:!

I i i I i I I I i

10000 1000 100 10 1 10 100 îOOO 10000
REMRE.:K5 RND RECOMMENDATIONE:

COPIES TO:

ANRLYSIS S'r':

MD GL

P DIVI5ION OF WPC.. INC.
PETR'OLEUÞ1 ANA v'T I CAL LF¯iBORF ORY SER"-.-' I CE

P.O. BOX 2652 =+:24 HOUR PHONE 307/266-1616
CA5PER, WYOMING 82602

AIR MONITORING SAMPLE NO. . . 4291
COMPLETE GAS SERVICE
CONSULTING CHEMISTS
POLLUTION CONTROL
WATER ANALYSIS vHIE 8:UN: 11.712.80

A SAMPLE OF: WATER FROM AMOCO PRODUCTION CO.
SAMPLE FROM: CHAMPLIN 272 C-1 SHUT IN 11/9/80
AT:... .. SECURED BY:...
SRMPLING CONDITIONS:... .. PRESS:... .. TEMP:...... TIME:...... DATE:...

L--lATER ANALŸS I S

DISSOLVED SOLIDS OTHER PROPERTIES

CATIONS MG/L ME/L PH 4.2
RESISTIVITY<0HM-METERS), 77 F .071

SODIUM-NA 13208.83 574.58
POTASSIÚM-K 2590 66.3
CALCIUM-CA 78376 2910.96
MAGNESIUM-MG 2450 201.39
BARIUM-BA O O
TOTRL CATIONE 96624. 82 4752. 24

ANIONS
4

CHLORIDE-CL 168000 4737.6
SULFATE-504 675 14.04
CARBONATE-CO3 0 0
BICARBONATE-HCO3 97.6 1.6
TOTAL ANIONS 168772.6 4753.24

IRON-FE <TOTAL> O
TOTAL DISSOLVED 50LIDS(CALC.) SULFIDE AS H25 0

265397.43

WRTER PRTTERNG--ME/L
LOGARITHMIC
10000 1000 100 10 1 10 100 1000 10000

-BA
-+:!

I i i I i I I I i

10000 1000 100 10 1 10 100 îOOO 10000
REMRE.:K5 RND RECOMMENDATIONE:

COPIES TO:

ANRLYSIS S'r':

MD GL



PETROLEUM FINFILŸT I CI¯IL LFIE:I¯¯IRATORY SER'·.·' I CE

P. O. BOX 2652 :+- 24 HOUR PHONE 307/Loß-1616
CRSPER.. WYONING 82602

RIR MONITORING RUN NO. . . 4292
COMPLETE GAS SERVICE
CONSULTING CHEMISTS
POLLt]TION CONTROL
WATER ANALYSIS DATE SECURED: 11/12/80

A SAMPLE OF: CHAMPLIN 372 C-1 SHUT-IN 11/9/80
SECURED FROM: AMOCO PRODUCTION COMPANY
AT:. . .

. SECURED BY:. . .

SAMPLING CONDITIONS:. . . . . . PRESS:. . . . . . TEMP: . . . . TIME: . . . DATE: . .

F¯ R FI CT I O P-J FI L Fi t--I FI L '-a-" S I S
Ed 14. 696 &60 DEG. F.

MOL. % WT. % LIO. %
------------------- CALC. SP. GR. 6. 6684 PROPANE CALC GPM

CARBON CALC. MOL. WT. 89. 687 BUTANES CALC GPM
DIOXIDE 0. 80 0. OO O. 00 CALC. VAP PRES 15. 27 PENTANES PLUS GPM

NITROGEN SP. GR. C 7 + 0. 6882 ETHANE CALC GPM
ONYGEN MOL. WT. C 7 + 100. 21 TOTAL GPM
H25 '..·'AP PRES C 7 + 1. 620
METHANE 0. 00 0. 00 0. 00 GFIL/#MOL C ? + 17. 464 B. T. U. /CU. FT.
ETHANE 0. 42 0. 14 0. 27 CF/GAL C 7 + 21. 729 DRY BRSIS
PROPANE 2. 17 1. 07 1. 40 LB/GAL C 7 + 5. 738 WET BASIS
ISO-BUTANE 2. 11 1. 37 1. 62 26. O R. P. '•.·'.

N-BUTANE 4. 26 2. 83 3. 22 GASOLINE 26 # PRODUCT
I50-PENTANE 5. 35 4. 30 4. 60 EXCESS C'45 12 # PRODUCT
N-PENTRNE 6. 34 5. 10 5. 41 EXCE55 C3
HE:=:.FiNES 21. 40 20. 56 20. 71 EXCESS C2 SULFUR RNALYSIS
HEPTANES 57. 85 64. 63 62. 76 14. O R. '·..'. P. (GR. /100CU. FT. >

--------------------- GASOL I NE HYDROGEN SULF I DE
TOTFIL 100. 00 100. 60 1 0. 00 EXCESS C4'S MERCAPTONS

EXCE55 C3 SULFIDES
EXCESS C2 RESIDUAL SULFUR
12. O R. V. P. MOISTURE CONTENT

GASOLINE <#/MMCU. FT.
EXCESS C4's
EXCESS C3
E CESS C2

F E B'r' R I

DD I
¯T I NHL_ DR T

f¯; RND REMAR S

-- --------- -- -o ---------

Viscosity 60 28.3 SUS

COPIES TO:

A DIVISION OF WPC..

PETROLEUM FINFILŸT I CI¯IL LFIE:I¯¯IRATORY SER'·.·' I CE

P. O. BOX 2652 :+- 24 HOUR PHONE 307/Loß-1616
CRSPER.. WYONING 82602

RIR MONITORING RUN NO. . . 4292
COMPLETE GAS SERVICE
CONSULTING CHEMISTS
POLLt]TION CONTROL
WATER ANALYSIS DATE SECURED: 11/12/80
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AT:. . .

. SECURED BY:. . .

SAMPLING CONDITIONS:. . . . . . PRESS:. . . . . . TEMP: . . . . TIME: . . . DATE: . .

F¯ R FI CT I O P-J FI L Fi t--I FI L '-a-" S I S
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H25 '..·'AP PRES C 7 + 1. 620
METHANE 0. 00 0. 00 0. 00 GFIL/#MOL C ? + 17. 464 B. T. U. /CU. FT.
ETHANE 0. 42 0. 14 0. 27 CF/GAL C 7 + 21. 729 DRY BRSIS
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N-BUTANE 4. 26 2. 83 3. 22 GASOLINE 26 # PRODUCT
I50-PENTANE 5. 35 4. 30 4. 60 EXCESS C'45 12 # PRODUCT
N-PENTRNE 6. 34 5. 10 5. 41 EXCE55 C3
HE:=:.FiNES 21. 40 20. 56 20. 71 EXCESS C2 SULFUR RNALYSIS
HEPTANES 57. 85 64. 63 62. 76 14. O R. '·..'. P. (GR. /100CU. FT. >

--------------------- GASOL I NE HYDROGEN SULF I DE
TOTFIL 100. 00 100. 60 1 0. 00 EXCESS C4'S MERCAPTONS

EXCE55 C3 SULFIDES
EXCESS C2 RESIDUAL SULFUR
12. O R. V. P. MOISTURE CONTENT

GASOLINE <#/MMCU. FT.
EXCESS C4's
EXCESS C3
E CESS C2

F E B'r' R I

DD I
¯T I NHL_ DR T

f¯; RND REMAR S

-- --------- -- -o ---------

Viscosity 60 28.3 SUS

COPIES TO:

A DIVISION OF WPC..



PETROLELIP1 IBr-JFILYT I CFIL LIBBORFITORY SER'·.··I I¯:E

P.O. BO MS2 :+:24 HOUR PHONE 307/: -1616

CASPER, WYOMING 82602

AIR MONITORING RUN NO...4290
COMPLETE GAS SERVICE
CONSULTING CHEMISTS
POLLUTION CONTROL
WATER ANALYSIS DATE SECURED: 11/12/80

A SAMPLE OF: CHAMPLIN 372 C-1 FLOW TEST UNIT 6962-6960 11/9/80
SECURED FROM: AMOCO PRODUCTION COMPANY ANGHOT2 RRNCH SUMMIT CO UTAH
AT:... .. SECURED BY:...
SAMPLING CONDITIONS:...... PRESS:.. .. TEMP: .. .. TIME: .. ... DRTE: ..

F¯RFICT I OFJFIL I¯¯IP--IEIL',r"S
I S

@ 14.696 &60 DEG. F.

MOL. % WT. % LIQ.%
------------------- CALC. SP. GR. 0.6651 PROPANE CALC GPM

CARBON CALC. MOL. WT. 88.105 BUTRNES CALC GPM
DIDMIDE 0.00 0.00 0.00 CALC. VAP PRES 17.17 PENTANES PLUS GPM

NITROGEN SP. GR. C 7 + 0.6882 ETHRNE CALC GPM
ONYGEN MOL. WT. C 7 + 100.20 TOTAL GPM
H2S VAP PRES C ? + 1.620
METHANE 0.00 0.00 0.00 GAL/#MOL C 7 + 17.464 B.T.U./CU.FT.
ETHANE 0.55 0.19 0.36 CF/GAL C 7 + 21.729 DRY BASIS
PROPANE 2. 04 1. 02 1. 23 LB/GAL C 7 + 5. 738 WET 'BASIS
ISO-BUTANE 2.25 1.48 1.75 26.0 R.P.V.
N-BUTRNE 4. 94 3. 26 3. 71 GPSOLINE 26 # PRODUCT
ISO-PENTRNE 6. 60 5. 41 5. 76 EXCESS C'45 12 # PRODUCT
N-PENTANE 7.85 G.42 6.77 EXCESS C2
HEXANES 24. 85 24. 31 24. 36 EXCESS C2 SULFUR ANRLYSIS
HEPTANES 50.92 57.91 55.96 14.0 R.V.P. (GR./100CU.FT.>

-------------------- GRSOL I NE HYDROGEN SULF I DE
TOTAL 100.00 100.00 100.00 EXCESS C4'S MERCAPTANS

EXCESS C3 SULFIDES
EXCESS C2 RESIDUBL SULFUR
12. O R. V. P. MOISTURE CONTENT

GASOLINE (#7MMOU. FT.
EXCESS C4'S
EXCESS C3
EXCESS C2

RL 4 E:Y FLANA A J CHE K.EE BY HAl I F EE E:Y

DD I T I NAL DATA AND REMARKS

scosity 28

COPIES TO:

A DIVISION OF WPC.

PETROLELIP1 IBr-JFILYT I CFIL LIBBORFITORY SER'·.··I I¯:E

P.O. BO MS2 :+:24 HOUR PHONE 307/: -1616

CASPER, WYOMING 82602

AIR MONITORING RUN NO...4290
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A SAMPLE OF: CHAMPLIN 372 C-1 FLOW TEST UNIT 6962-6960 11/9/80
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I S
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ISO-PENTRNE 6. 60 5. 41 5. 76 EXCESS C'45 12 # PRODUCT
N-PENTANE 7.85 G.42 6.77 EXCESS C2
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HEPTANES 50.92 57.91 55.96 14.0 R.V.P. (GR./100CU.FT.>
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TOTAL 100.00 100.00 100.00 EXCESS C4'S MERCAPTANS

EXCESS C3 SULFIDES
EXCESS C2 RESIDUBL SULFUR
12. O R. V. P. MOISTURE CONTENT

GASOLINE (#7MMOU. FT.
EXCESS C4'S
EXCESS C3
EXCESS C2

RL 4 E:Y FLANA A J CHE K.EE BY HAl I F EE E:Y

DD I T I NAL DATA AND REMARKS

scosity 28

COPIES TO:

A DIVISION OF WPC.



Forin 0003 Sillmill |\ 10 I II
(Ser allier insit nw

STATE L UTAH ,.,,,s.,,,¡,.

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RE QURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING i I.EASE DANMINATroN AND SERIAI O.

Fee

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETlON REPORTAND LOG *
6. IF INDIM, MOTm ORiiiE NAME

la. TYPE OF WELL: (I r.AFIL
DaY Other Ì. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF COMPLETION:

11"sÐ <'21'
'" is.O maer __ FARM OR LEASE NAME

-2 a avovaron Champl in 372 Amoco "C"
Amoco Production Company 9. WELL NO.

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR

P.O. Box 17675, Salt Lake City, UT 84117 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements)• Anschu LL Ranch
at surrace NW/4 Section 23, 866.1 ' FNL 527' FWL ii. secla'&R., M., OR BLOCK AND SURVEY

At top prod. interval reported below

Sec. 23 T4N-R7E
At total depth

14. PER311T NO. DATE ISSEED 12. COUNTT OR 13. STATE
PARISþ

.

43-043-30143 | 8/8/80 Summit ,
Utah

15. DATE SPEDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 17. DATE COMPL. (R€Gdy (0 prod.) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, GE, E )e 19. ELEV. CASINGHEAD

8/12/80 10/10/80 12/10/80 6988' GR ------

2Ô. TOTAL DEPTH, MD & TVD 21. PLUG, BACK T.D., MD & TVD 22. IF STELTIPLE COMPL., 23. INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS
HOW MANY* DRILLED BY

7292' 7220 ' Two , \Surface-TD | ---------

24. PRODUCING INTERVAI (8), OF TH1S COMPLETlON--TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND TVD)* 26. WAS DIRECTIONAL

6155' - 6980' Twin Creek scav=v sao.

7056' - 7098' Nugget Yes
26. TTPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN 27. WAS WELL CORED

Dual CNL-FDCw/Caliper BHC Sonic w/GR DIL No
28 CASING RECORD (Report all stringa set in well)

CASING SIZE WEIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED

16" 74'
9-5/8" 32.3# 1518' 124" 10TTO3x

7" 23 & 26# 7300' 8-3/4" 750 sx

29. LINER RECORD 30. TUBING RECORD

SIZE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT* SCREEN (MD) SIZE OFPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

(TC) 2-7/8" _ lÏ133' 6100'
one (N) 2-3/8" 7069' 7025'

31. PERyonATioN RECORD (Interval, size and number) 32. ACID. SHOT, FRACTURE. CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL (MD) AMOUNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL USED

See Attachment "A" See Attachment "A"

33 * PRODUCTION
DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD (Flowing, gaa lift, pumping-size and type of pump) WELL STATUS (Producing Of

Flowing shut-in) Shut-In
HOf TESTED CI )'T PROD'N. FOR OIL-B L. GAS \IEF WATER-BBL. GAS-OIL RATIO

N) 1Ò/ Ò R 9/Š =="I "="I° 7Ë \ 3980 77 53891:1
TC) 11/25/80 _ 17 37/64 92- __ 9 2 16637·1

F . T IBING PRESS. CASING VitENatul: CALCULATED 011 BRI . GAS . gg L. (ML VITT-API (CORR.)

N) 1Ò --- "'"" " i 148 i 7¾6
TC) 4L50L --- | 129 I RS60

3 . DISPOSITION OF OAS (80ld, Ma€d for fu€l, Utnf€d, €lc ) TEST WIT SS

Sold when put on production
35. LIST OF ATTACHMENTS

Attachment "A"
36. I hereby certify that t o information is complete and correct as determined from all lable records

SIGNED E. R. NICHOLSOOJ
TITLE Administrative Supem1Aisms & MedNG12/23/80

*(See Instructionsand Spaces for Additional Data on Reverse

Forin 0003 Sillmill |\ 10 I II
(Ser allier insit nw

STATE L UTAH ,.,,,s.,,,¡,.

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RE QURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING i I.EASE DANMINATroN AND SERIAI O.

Fee

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETlON REPORTAND LOG *
6. IF INDIM, MOTm ORiiiE NAME

la. TYPE OF WELL: (I r.AFIL
DaY Other Ì. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF COMPLETION:

11"sÐ <'21'
'" is.O maer __ FARM OR LEASE NAME

-2 a avovaron Champl in 372 Amoco "C"
Amoco Production Company 9. WELL NO.

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR

P.O. Box 17675, Salt Lake City, UT 84117 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements)• Anschu LL Ranch
at surrace NW/4 Section 23, 866.1 ' FNL 527' FWL ii. secla'&R., M., OR BLOCK AND SURVEY

At top prod. interval reported below

Sec. 23 T4N-R7E
At total depth

14. PER311T NO. DATE ISSEED 12. COUNTT OR 13. STATE
PARISþ

.

43-043-30143 | 8/8/80 Summit ,
Utah

15. DATE SPEDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 17. DATE COMPL. (R€Gdy (0 prod.) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, GE, E )e 19. ELEV. CASINGHEAD

8/12/80 10/10/80 12/10/80 6988' GR ------

2Ô. TOTAL DEPTH, MD & TVD 21. PLUG, BACK T.D., MD & TVD 22. IF STELTIPLE COMPL., 23. INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS
HOW MANY* DRILLED BY

7292' 7220 ' Two , \Surface-TD | ---------

24. PRODUCING INTERVAI (8), OF TH1S COMPLETlON--TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND TVD)* 26. WAS DIRECTIONAL

6155' - 6980' Twin Creek scav=v sao.

7056' - 7098' Nugget Yes
26. TTPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN 27. WAS WELL CORED

Dual CNL-FDCw/Caliper BHC Sonic w/GR DIL No
28 CASING RECORD (Report all stringa set in well)

CASING SIZE WEIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED

16" 74'
9-5/8" 32.3# 1518' 124" 10TTO3x

7" 23 & 26# 7300' 8-3/4" 750 sx

29. LINER RECORD 30. TUBING RECORD

SIZE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT* SCREEN (MD) SIZE OFPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

(TC) 2-7/8" _ lÏ133' 6100'
one (N) 2-3/8" 7069' 7025'

31. PERyonATioN RECORD (Interval, size and number) 32. ACID. SHOT, FRACTURE. CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL (MD) AMOUNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL USED

See Attachment "A" See Attachment "A"

33 * PRODUCTION
DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD (Flowing, gaa lift, pumping-size and type of pump) WELL STATUS (Producing Of

Flowing shut-in) Shut-In
HOf TESTED CI )'T PROD'N. FOR OIL-B L. GAS \IEF WATER-BBL. GAS-OIL RATIO

N) 1Ò/ Ò R 9/Š =="I "="I° 7Ë \ 3980 77 53891:1
TC) 11/25/80 _ 17 37/64 92- __ 9 2 16637·1

F . T IBING PRESS. CASING VitENatul: CALCULATED 011 BRI . GAS . gg L. (ML VITT-API (CORR.)

N) 1Ò --- "'"" " i 148 i 7¾6
TC) 4L50L --- | 129 I RS60

3 . DISPOSITION OF OAS (80ld, Ma€d for fu€l, Utnf€d, €lc ) TEST WIT SS

Sold when put on production
35. LIST OF ATTACHMENTS

Attachment "A"
36. I hereby certify that t o information is complete and correct as determined from all lable records

SIGNED E. R. NICHOLSOOJ
TITLE Administrative Supem1Aisms & MedNG12/23/80

*(See Instructionsand Spaces for Additional Data on Reverse
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January 5, 1981

Amoco Production Company
P.O. Box 17675
Salt Lake City, Utah 84117

RE: Well No. Champlin 372 Amoco "C" #1
Sec. 23, T. AN, R. 7E.,
Summit County, Utah

Gentlemen:

According to our records, a "Well Completion Report" filed with this
office December 23, 1980, from above referred to well indicates the follow-

ing electric logs were run: Dual, CNL-FDC w/Caliper, BHC Sonte w/GR, DIL.

As of todays date this office has not received these logs.

Anle C-5, General Rules and Regulations and Rules of Practice and
Procedure, requires that a well log shall be filed with the Commission

together with a copy of the electric and radioactivity log.

Your prompt attention to the above will be greatly appreciated.

Sincerely,

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

BARBARAHILL
WELL RECORDS

January 5, 1981

Amoco Production Company
P.O. Box 17675
Salt Lake City, Utah 84117

RE: Well No. Champlin 372 Amoco "C" #1
Sec. 23, T. AN, R. 7E.,
Summit County, Utah

Gentlemen:

According to our records, a "Well Completion Report" filed with this
office December 23, 1980, from above referred to well indicates the follow-

ing electric logs were run: Dual, CNL-FDC w/Caliper, BHC Sonte w/GR, DIL.

As of todays date this office has not received these logs.

Anle C-5, General Rules and Regulations and Rules of Practice and
Procedure, requires that a well log shall be filed with the Commission

together with a copy of the electric and radioactivity log.

Your prompt attention to the above will be greatly appreciated.

Sincerely,

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

BARBARAHILL
WELL RECORDS
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ATl'ACHMENT"A"

Perforations :

Nugget: 7056 '
- 7072 ' 4 JSPF

7082' - 7098' 4 JSPF
Twin Creek: 6862' - 6883' 4 JSPF

6888 '
- 6904' 4 JSPF

6909 '
- 6928 ' 4 JSPF

6944' - 6960 ' A JSPF

6972 '
- 6980 ' 4 JSPF

6572 '
- 6577 ' 4 JSPF

6584' - 6599' 4 JSPF
6654' - 6658 ' A JSPF
6665' - 6680' 4 JSPF

6712' - 6726' 4 JSPF
6748 '

- 6770 ' 4 JSPF

6797' - 6800' A JSPF

6399' - 6406' A JSPF
6410 '

- 6420 ' 4 JSPF

6426 '
- 6452 ' 4 JSPF

6464' - 6490 ' 4 JSPF
6508 '

- 6520 ' A JSPF

6265' - 6270' 4 JSPF

6275 '
- 6282 ' 4 JSPF

6300 '
- 6306 ' 4 JSPF

6312' - 6334' A JSPF

6339 '
- 6359 ' 4 JSPF

6155 '
- 6176 ' 4 JSPF

6180 '
- 6185 ' 4 JSPF

6189' - 6194' A JSPF
6221' - 6272' 4 JSPF

Acid:

Interval Anount and Kind of Material Used

6155 '
- 6232 ' 6300 gal 28%HC1

6265 '
- 6359 ' 9000 gal 28%HC1

6399 '
- 6520 ' 11250 gal 28%HC1 p

6572 '
- 6770 ' 11250 gal 28%HCl y

6862' - 6980' 12000
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Perforations :

Nugget: 7056 '
- 7072 ' 4 JSPF

7082' - 7098' 4 JSPF
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6654' - 6658 ' A JSPF
6665' - 6680' 4 JSPF
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6339 '
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6155 '
- 6176 ' 4 JSPF

6180 '
- 6185 ' 4 JSPF

6189' - 6194' A JSPF
6221' - 6272' 4 JSPF

Acid:

Interval Anount and Kind of Material Used

6155 '
- 6232 ' 6300 gal 28%HC1

6265 '
- 6359 ' 9000 gal 28%HC1

6399 '
- 6520 ' 11250 gal 28%HC1 p

6572 '
- 6770 ' 11250 gal 28%HCl y

6862' - 6980' 12000



AMOCO Amoco Production Company
Denver Region
1670 Broadway
P.O.Box800
Denver, Colorado 80201

Don F. Crespo. Jr.
303-830-404

Regional Administrative Manager. Production

January 22, 1990

State of Utah
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
355 West North Temple
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, UT 84180-1203

File: DDL-2056-980.3

Annual Report of Drilling-Suspended,
Shut-In and Temporarily-Abandoned Wells

As operator of the Anschutz Ranch East Operation Center and in
accordance with Rule R615-8-10 of the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation
General Rules, listed below is the annual status report for wells that
have been shut-in or teporarily-abandoned for more

thañ¯3U~Bonsecutive

days as of December 31, 1989. The wells listed are located in Summit
County, Utah.

Please note, there were no drilling wells that had suspended drilling
operations as of December 31, 1989. Questions regarding well status
may be directed to David Lovato at (303) 830-5321.

WELL NAME API NUMBER COMMENTS

ARE 081A 43-043-30130 SHUT-IN
ARE E28-06 43-043-30226 SHUT-IN

ARE W12-04 43-043-30283 SHUT-IN

ARE W29-04 43-043-30129 SHUT-IN
CH 387 BlA 43-043-30168 SHUT-IN TWIN CREEK
CH 372 C14 $40436301434 SHUT-IN TWIN CREEKR•
CR 372 CÑ 43-043 301434 SHUT-IN NU T
CH 372 D1 43-043-30170 SHUT-IN NUGGET
ISLAND RANCHB1 43-043-30109 SHUT-IN TWIN CREEK
ISLAND RANCHD1 43-043-30161 SHUT-IN WEBER
AMOCO-CHAMPF & S 43-043-30078 SHUT-IN

CH 544 D1 43-043-30210 PX A (12/89)
CH 544 D2 43-043-30246 PX A (12/89)

DJL/rlt

ec: Bureau of Land Management
324 South State, Suite 301
Salt Lake City, Utah

AMOCO Amoco Production Company
Denver Region
1670 Broadway
P.O.Box800
Denver, Colorado 80201

Don F. Crespo. Jr.
303-830-404

Regional Administrative Manager. Production

January 22, 1990

State of Utah
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
355 West North Temple
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, UT 84180-1203

File: DDL-2056-980.3

Annual Report of Drilling-Suspended,
Shut-In and Temporarily-Abandoned Wells

As operator of the Anschutz Ranch East Operation Center and in
accordance with Rule R615-8-10 of the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation
General Rules, listed below is the annual status report for wells that
have been shut-in or teporarily-abandoned for more

thañ¯3U~Bonsecutive

days as of December 31, 1989. The wells listed are located in Summit
County, Utah.

Please note, there were no drilling wells that had suspended drilling
operations as of December 31, 1989. Questions regarding well status
may be directed to David Lovato at (303) 830-5321.

WELL NAME API NUMBER COMMENTS

ARE 081A 43-043-30130 SHUT-IN
ARE E28-06 43-043-30226 SHUT-IN

ARE W12-04 43-043-30283 SHUT-IN

ARE W29-04 43-043-30129 SHUT-IN
CH 387 BlA 43-043-30168 SHUT-IN TWIN CREEK
CH 372 C14 $40436301434 SHUT-IN TWIN CREEKR•
CR 372 CÑ 43-043 301434 SHUT-IN NU T
CH 372 D1 43-043-30170 SHUT-IN NUGGET
ISLAND RANCHB1 43-043-30109 SHUT-IN TWIN CREEK
ISLAND RANCHD1 43-043-30161 SHUT-IN WEBER
AMOCO-CHAMPF & S 43-043-30078 SHUT-IN

CH 544 D1 43-043-30210 PX A (12/89)
CH 544 D2 43-043-30246 PX A (12/89)

DJL/rlt

ec: Bureau of Land Management
324 South State, Suite 301
Salt Lake City, Utah



AMOCO Amoco Production Company
Denver Region
1670 Broadway
P.O.Box800
Denver, Colorado 80201
303-83 4040DonF.Crespo,Jr.

Regional Administrative Manager, Production OMOUNO
GILGAS&M!NING

February 4, 1991

State of Utah
Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
355 West N. Temple
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, UT 84180-1203

File: DFC-100-980.3

Annual Report of Drilling-suspended,
Shut-in and Temporarily-Abandoned Wells

As operator of the Anschutz Ranch East Operation Center and in accordancewith Rule 615-8-10 of the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation general Rules,Listed below is the annual status report for wells that have been shut-in
or temporarily-abandoned for more than 30 consecutive days as of December31, 1990. The wells listed are located in Summit County, Utah.

Well Name API Number Comments

Anschutz Ranch East 81A 43-043-30130 Shut-in
Anschutz Ranch East W12-04 43-043-30283 Shut-in
Champlin 387 B1A 43-043-30168 Shut-ini(Twin Creek)Champlin 372 C1£1brygÆ.7x-43-043-30143 Shut-in (Twin Creek)Champlin 372 C1 43-043-30143 Shut-in (Nugget)Champlin 372 D1 43-043-30170 Shut-in (Nugget)Island Ranch B1 43-043-30109 Shut-in (Twin Creek)Island Ranch D1 43-043-30161 Shut-in (Weber)Amoco Champlin F & S 43-043-30078 Shut-in
Champlin 544 D1 43-043-30210 Px A (12/89)Champlin 544 D2 43-043-30246 Px A (12/89)Champlin 846 Amoco /B/ #1 43-043-30253 Shut-in

Please note that there were no drilling wells that had suspended operationsas of December 31, 1990. Questions regarding this report may be directedto James Camargo at (303) 830-4233.

cc: Bureau of Land Management
324 South State, Suite 301
Salt Lake City, Utah

AMOCO Amoco Production Company
Denver Region
1670 Broadway
P.O.Box800
Denver, Colorado 80201
303-83 4040DonF.Crespo,Jr.

Regional Administrative Manager, Production OMOUNO
GILGAS&M!NING

February 4, 1991

State of Utah
Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
355 West N. Temple
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, UT 84180-1203

File: DFC-100-980.3

Annual Report of Drilling-suspended,
Shut-in and Temporarily-Abandoned Wells

As operator of the Anschutz Ranch East Operation Center and in accordancewith Rule 615-8-10 of the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation general Rules,Listed below is the annual status report for wells that have been shut-in
or temporarily-abandoned for more than 30 consecutive days as of December31, 1990. The wells listed are located in Summit County, Utah.

Well Name API Number Comments

Anschutz Ranch East 81A 43-043-30130 Shut-in
Anschutz Ranch East W12-04 43-043-30283 Shut-in
Champlin 387 B1A 43-043-30168 Shut-ini(Twin Creek)Champlin 372 C1£1brygÆ.7x-43-043-30143 Shut-in (Twin Creek)Champlin 372 C1 43-043-30143 Shut-in (Nugget)Champlin 372 D1 43-043-30170 Shut-in (Nugget)Island Ranch B1 43-043-30109 Shut-in (Twin Creek)Island Ranch D1 43-043-30161 Shut-in (Weber)Amoco Champlin F & S 43-043-30078 Shut-in
Champlin 544 D1 43-043-30210 Px A (12/89)Champlin 544 D2 43-043-30246 Px A (12/89)Champlin 846 Amoco /B/ #1 43-043-30253 Shut-in

Please note that there were no drilling wells that had suspended operationsas of December 31, 1990. Questions regarding this report may be directedto James Camargo at (303) 830-4233.

cc: Bureau of Land Management
324 South State, Suite 301
Salt Lake City, Utah



AMOCO Amoco Production Company

Northwestern U.S. Business Unit
Amoco Building
1670 Broadway
Post Office Box 800
Denver, Colorado 80201
303-830-4040

February 24, 199g/

State of Utah
Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
355 W. N. Temple
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

File: GRW-046-980.3

Annual Report of Drilling - Suspended,
Shut-in and Temporarily-abandoned Wells

As operator of the Anschutz Ranch East Operation Center and
in accordance with Rule 615-8-10 of the Utah Oil and Gas
Conservation general rules, find attached annual status
reports for all wells that have been shut-in for more than
30 consecutive days as of December 31, 1991.

Please note that there were no drilling wells on which
drilling operations have been suspended for more thLan 30
consecutive days as of December 31. Also, no wells have
been temporarily abandoned for more than 30 consecutive days
as of December 31.

G. R. West
Sr. Staff Admin. Supervisor

MAT/jms

Attachments

cc: Bureau of Land Management
324 South State, Suite 301
Salt Lake City, UT

AMOCO Amoco Production Company

Northwestern U.S. Business Unit
Amoco Building
1670 Broadway
Post Office Box 800
Denver, Colorado 80201
303-830-4040

February 24, 199g/

State of Utah
Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
355 W. N. Temple
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

File: GRW-046-980.3

Annual Report of Drilling - Suspended,
Shut-in and Temporarily-abandoned Wells

As operator of the Anschutz Ranch East Operation Center and
in accordance with Rule 615-8-10 of the Utah Oil and Gas
Conservation general rules, find attached annual status
reports for all wells that have been shut-in for more than
30 consecutive days as of December 31, 1991.

Please note that there were no drilling wells on which
drilling operations have been suspended for more thLan 30
consecutive days as of December 31. Also, no wells have
been temporarily abandoned for more than 30 consecutive days
as of December 31.

G. R. West
Sr. Staff Admin. Supervisor

MAT/jms

Attachments

cc: Bureau of Land Management
324 South State, Suite 301
Salt Lake City, UT



Forni9 STAT" )F UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF .TURAL RESOURCES 6. Lease Designation and Serial Number
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

7. Indian Allottee or Tribe Name

SUNDR ÑÒTICES AÑD REPORTSÒN El L
Eu,--ud vanç4e y w-6 014,gebdyvywooday am wevetum gg aannponedwegs. 8.UnitorCommunitizationAgreement

UneAPPLICAT10N FOR PERMLT-fŒtuchpio¾¢àlt

1. Type of Well

O °wil, O Gwas other(specify)
Champlin 372 Amoco /C/#1

2. Name of Operator 10. API Well Number
Amoco Production Company 43-043 -30143-00

3. Address of Operator 4. Telephone Nu ber 11. Field and Pool, or Wildcat
P. O. Box 800, Denver, CO 80201 (303) 830-5105 Anschutz Ranch

5. Location of Well

Footage : 866' FNL x 527' FWL County : Summit
QQ. See, T., R., M. : Sec. 23, TAN, R7E SW NW NW state : UTAH

àà. ' CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE Ni TURE OE NOT¯ÏCE;
REPORT, OR OTHER DATA ,

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

O Abandonment New Construction O Abandonment O New Construction
O Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing O casingnepair O Pull or^tter casing
O Change of Plans

.
Recompletion O Change of Plans O Shoot or Acidize

O Conversion to Injection Shoot or Acidize Conversion to Injection Vent or Flare
O Fracture Treat Vent or Flare Fracture Treat Water Shut-OH
O Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off Other Annual Status Report
O °©er

Date of Work Completion
Approximate Date Work Will Start

Report results of MultipleCompletions and Recompletions to different reservoirson WELLCOMPLETIONOR RECOMPLET10NAND LOG form.
Must be accompanied by atement verification report.

13. DESÓRIBEPROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell is directionally drilled, give subsurfacelocations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinentto this work.)

The above well 'is in a "Shut-in - High WOR" status due to excessive ater production in both
the Twin Creek (4304330143-10955) and Nugget (4304330143-01395) formations.

The well is being held for a possible future water injection.

Please direct any questions regarding this sundry to Marcy Tafoya at (303) 830-5105.

14. I hereby certify that the fore oing is true and orrect

Name & Signature Title Sr. Staff Adn. Supvr. Date
,

(State Use Only)

m/90) See instructions on Moran

Forni9 STAT" )F UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF .TURAL RESOURCES 6. Lease Designation and Serial Number
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

7. Indian Allottee or Tribe Name

SUNDR ÑÒTICES AÑD REPORTSÒN El L
Eu,--ud vanç4e y w-6 014,gebdyvywooday am wevetum gg aannponedwegs. 8.UnitorCommunitizationAgreement

UneAPPLICAT10N FOR PERMLT-fŒtuchpio¾¢àlt

1. Type of Well

O °wil, O Gwas other(specify)
Champlin 372 Amoco /C/#1

2. Name of Operator 10. API Well Number
Amoco Production Company 43-043 -30143-00

3. Address of Operator 4. Telephone Nu ber 11. Field and Pool, or Wildcat
P. O. Box 800, Denver, CO 80201 (303) 830-5105 Anschutz Ranch

5. Location of Well

Footage : 866' FNL x 527' FWL County : Summit
QQ. See, T., R., M. : Sec. 23, TAN, R7E SW NW NW state : UTAH

àà. ' CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE Ni TURE OE NOT¯ÏCE;
REPORT, OR OTHER DATA ,

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

O Abandonment New Construction O Abandonment O New Construction
O Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing O casingnepair O Pull or^tter casing
O Change of Plans

.
Recompletion O Change of Plans O Shoot or Acidize

O Conversion to Injection Shoot or Acidize Conversion to Injection Vent or Flare
O Fracture Treat Vent or Flare Fracture Treat Water Shut-OH
O Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off Other Annual Status Report
O °©er

Date of Work Completion
Approximate Date Work Will Start

Report results of MultipleCompletions and Recompletions to different reservoirson WELLCOMPLETIONOR RECOMPLET10NAND LOG form.
Must be accompanied by atement verification report.

13. DESÓRIBEPROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell is directionally drilled, give subsurfacelocations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinentto this work.)

The above well 'is in a "Shut-in - High WOR" status due to excessive ater production in both
the Twin Creek (4304330143-10955) and Nugget (4304330143-01395) formations.

The well is being held for a possible future water injection.

Please direct any questions regarding this sundry to Marcy Tafoya at (303) 830-5105.

14. I hereby certify that the fore oing is true and orrect

Name & Signature Title Sr. Staff Adn. Supvr. Date
,

(State Use Only)

m/90) See instructions on Moran



AMOCO
Amoco Production Company
Northwestern U.S. Business Unit
Amoco Building
1670Broadway
PostOfficeBox800
Denver,Colorado80201
303-830-4040

February 1, 1993

State of Utah
Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
355 W. N. Temple
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, UT 84180-1203

File: GRW-023-980.3

Annual Report of Drilling - Suspended,
Shut-In and Temporarily-Abandoned Wells

As operator of the Anschutz Ranch East Operation Center and in accordance with
Rule 615-8-10 of the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation general rules, find attached
annual status reports for all wells that have been shut-in for more than 30
consecutive days as of December 31, 1992.

Please note that there were no drilling wells on which drilling operations have
been suspended for more than 30 consecutive days as of December 31. Also, no
wells have been temporarily abandoned for more than 30 consecutive days as of
December 31.

G.R. West
Sr. Staff Admin. Supervisor

MAT/mll

Attachments

cc: Bureau of Land Management
324 South State, Suite 301
Salt Lake City, UT 84111-2303

FEB0 3 1993

DMSION

AMOCO
Amoco Production Company
Northwestern U.S. Business Unit
Amoco Building
1670Broadway
PostOfficeBox800
Denver,Colorado80201
303-830-4040

February 1, 1993

State of Utah
Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
355 W. N. Temple
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, UT 84180-1203

File: GRW-023-980.3

Annual Report of Drilling - Suspended,
Shut-In and Temporarily-Abandoned Wells

As operator of the Anschutz Ranch East Operation Center and in accordance with
Rule 615-8-10 of the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation general rules, find attached
annual status reports for all wells that have been shut-in for more than 30
consecutive days as of December 31, 1992.

Please note that there were no drilling wells on which drilling operations have
been suspended for more than 30 consecutive days as of December 31. Also, no
wells have been temporarily abandoned for more than 30 consecutive days as of
December 31.

G.R. West
Sr. Staff Admin. Supervisor

MAT/mll

Attachments

cc: Bureau of Land Management
324 South State, Suite 301
Salt Lake City, UT 84111-2303

FEB0 3 1993

DMSION



FoAMS - STATEOF UTAH

DIVISION C IL GAS ANDMINING
5. Laase Designadon and Serial Number

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6.findin.MacrTheName:

Do not use this form for proposals to ddll new wells, deepen exisdng wells, or to teenter plugged and abandoned wells. 7. UnitAgreement Name:

Use APPUCATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLOR DEEPEN form for auch proposals.

8. Well Name and Number:
1.TypeofWen: oltO GAS OTHER: Champlinu372 Amoco /c/#1
2. Name of Operator- 9. APIWellNumber:

Amoco Production Company 43-043-30143-00

3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat

P.O. Box 800, Denver, CO 80201 Anschutz Ranch
4. Locationof Well

Footages: 866' FNL x 527' FWL county: Summit
.

NW NW Sec. 23-TAN-R7E
. Utah

11· CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NiTURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit in Duplicate) (SubmR Original Form Only)

O Abandonment O New Construction O Abandonment O New Construction

O casingRepair O Pull or Alter casing O Casing Repair O Pull or Alter Casing

O Change of Plans O Recompletion O Change of Plans O Shoot or Acidize

O conversionto injection O Shoot or Acidize O conversionto injection O Vent or Flare

O Fracture Treat O Vent or Flare O Fracture Treat O Water Shut-Off

O Multiple Completion O Water Shut-Off B Other Annual Status Report

O Other
Date of work completion

Approximate date work will start Aeport results of Multiple Completions and Recompletione to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION AND LOGfonn.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verificationreport

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSEDOR COMPLETEDOPERAT10NS(Clearlystate all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell Is directionally drilled,give subsurface locations and measured and true
verticaldepths for all markersand zones pertinent to this work.)

The above well is in a "Shut-In - High woR" status due to excessive water production
in both the Twin Creek (4304330143-10955) and Nugget (4304330143-01395) formations.

The well is being held for a possible future water injection.

Please direct any questions regarding this,sundr'y to Marcy Tafoya at (303)830-5105.

am.asignatur.: C Tiue:Sr.Staff Adm. Supvr. oat.:

(This space for State use only)

FEB031993
Og2) (See Instructions on Aeverse Side)

- DMSION
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(This space for State use only)

FEB031993
Og2) (See Instructions on Aeverse Side)
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$ 'P.O. BON 2652 * 24 HOUP PHONE 307/265-1516 FEB16 683CASFER.. WYOMINO 82€02
IR MONITORING

J. 5561
:ONPLETE GAS 5ER'.•'ICE

OIL,GAS&MININ'ONSULTING CHEMISTS
POLLUTION CONTROL
-¿ATER ANALYSIS

DATE SECURED: 5/7/81
SAMPLE OF: 372-C ANGCHUT2 RANCH NUGGET WELLHEAD TREE 5/5/81ECURED FROM: AMOCO PRODUCTION CO. SUMMIT CO UTRH

T:........................................... SECURED BY:..................
AMPLING CÓNDITIONS:...... PREss:.1650Ñ. TEMP:

....... TIME:
...... DATE:

......

I FRFICT I ONAL ANALYS I E.14.596 &GO DEG. F.
MOL. % WT,.% LIO.%
------------------- CALC..SP. GR. 0.6773 PROPANE CALC GPM 0.774

ARSON
CALC. MOL. WT. BUTANES CALC GPM O.4SO

DIOXIDE 0.05

CALC. VAP PRES PENTANES PLUS GFT1 0.213
RAITROGEN 6.04 SP. GR. C + EHTANE CALC GPM 2.660
OXYGEN

MOL. WT. C +
TOTAL GPM

825 0.00 VAP PRES C +1ETHANE 81.29 GPM GAL/MOL C + B.T.U./CU.FTmTHANE 7.72 2.860 CF/GAL C +
DRY SASIS 1101

PROPANE 2.82 0.774 LS/GAL C +
WET BASIS 1982

SO-SUTANE 0.66 0.215 26.0 R.P.V.INBUTANE 0.34 0.255 GASOLINE
. 26 # PRODUCT 285

ISO-PENTANE O.28 0.111 EXCESS C4'S 12 # PRODUCT 0.190
4-PENTANE O. 28 O. 102 EXCE55 C3 'EXAi.'ES 0.00 0.000 EXCE55 C2 5ULFUR ANALYSI5NEPTANES 0.00 0.000 14.0 R.V.P. (GR./100CU.FT,>---------

---------- GASOLINE HYDROGEN SULFIDE
OTAL 100.00 3.527 EXCESS C4"S MERCRPTAN5EXCESS C3 5ULFIDESEXCESS C2 RE5IDUAL SULFUR12,0 R.V.P. MOI5TURE CONTENTGASOLINE <#/MMCU.FT.>EXCESS C4'S

, EXCESS C3
E×CESS C2

----
- -L

A At4 DE
F E

RDO I T I ONAL DATA AND REMARKS

1ES
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DIVISION OF Oli GAS AND MINING
•

' '
5. ËEIcesignationand Senal Number

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 8.lfindian.AllatteeorTribeName:

Do not use triis form for proposals to drill new weils, deepen exisdng wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 7. UnitAgreement Name:
Use APPUCATION FOR PERMfr TO ORILL CR DEEPEN farm for such proposais,

type of wen: OIL Q GAS OTHER: 8. Wed Name and Numoer:

Champlin 372 Amoco C #1
9. API Well Number:

Name of Operater
Amoco Production Company 43-043-30143

Bdress and Telephone Number
10. Field and Pool, or Wildcac

P.O. Box 800, Denver, CO 80202 Anschutz Ranch
«.sonotw•"NW/4 866.1' FNL X 527' FWL

Summittages:
County:Sec. 23-TAN-R7E

x:, s•e..T.,R..M.: stat.: Ut ah

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT

(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

X Abandonment O New Construction O Abandonment O New Construction
Casing Repair O Pull or Alter casing O casingRepair O Puli or After casing
Change of Plans O Recompletion O Change of Plans O Shoot or Acidize
Conversion to Injection O Shoot or Acidize O conversionto injection O Ventor Flare
fracture Treat O ventor Flare O Fracture Treat O Water Shut-Off
Multiple Completion O Water Shut-Off O Other
3ther

Date of work completion
aroximate date work will start Report results of Multipie Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL

COMPLEnoN CA AECOMPLETION AND t.CG form.
* Must be accompanied by a cement verificationreport

JC.916E PROPCSED CA COMPLETED CPERAT10NS (C:earty state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If well is directionally drilled, give suosurface locations and measured and truecal depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Amoco Production Company proposes the attached procedure.

If you have any questions please call Gigi Martinez at (303) 830-4781.

Permit Agent 1/12/98Signature: { Title: Date:

for State use on y)

(See instructions on Reverse
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for State use on y)

(See instructions on Reverse



Plugback Procedure
Champlin 372C-1
NW Sec 23, T4N, R7E
7011' KB 6995' GL
Summit County, Utah

1)Test anchors, if needed put new ones in
2) MIRU service rig
3) Kill well if necessary, fill tbg and csg
4) ND tree, NU BOPS or hydrill, (check well head size)
5) Release and pull short string, if string won't pull, RU wireline and cut 10' above
packer.
6) Pull long string and model A-5 packer set at 6086'.
7) TIH with retrieving tool to release and retrieve model 'R' packer set at 7069'.
8) TOOH
9) TIH with cement retainer, setting tool, and stinger and set at 7000'.
10) Pump 59 sks (with additives per Dowell's procedure) cement down tubing to squeeze
off perfs, if no pressure, sting out with 2 bbls of slurry left in tbg. Reverse out.
11) Pump 350 sxs cement on top of retainer, displace tubing, leaving 250' slurry in tbg.
TOH w/tubing 300' if wet
12) TOOH.
13) RDMO service

Plugback Procedure
Champlin 372C-1
NW Sec 23, T4N, R7E
7011' KB 6995' GL
Summit County, Utah

1)Test anchors, if needed put new ones in
2) MIRU service rig
3) Kill well if necessary, fill tbg and csg
4) ND tree, NU BOPS or hydrill, (check well head size)
5) Release and pull short string, if string won't pull, RU wireline and cut 10' above
packer.
6) Pull long string and model A-5 packer set at 6086'.
7) TIH with retrieving tool to release and retrieve model 'R' packer set at 7069'.
8) TOOH
9) TIH with cement retainer, setting tool, and stinger and set at 7000'.
10) Pump 59 sks (with additives per Dowell's procedure) cement down tubing to squeeze
off perfs, if no pressure, sting out with 2 bbls of slurry left in tbg. Reverse out.
11) Pump 350 sxs cement on top of retainer, displace tubing, leaving 250' slurry in tbg.
TOH w/tubing 300' if wet
12) TOOH.
13) RDMO service



Postdt* Fax Note 7671 6 Ž£)( ek

'Tche Db ' yvn Hr to
ellbore Diagram o c°¾QCD

Champlin 372 C#1 49 Ÿ¾'
Fa Fax #

section 23, TAN R7E Sumit Councy, -UT 7011' K3 6995' GL

Long String
-

2 3/8" cubies N-80 A,7 #/ft
_Hydril 6100'

af ik 9 S/8" casing 32.3 #/ft E-40

m i SA 1518'

Twin Greek 5390' 2 -< 3akar Model A-5 Packer 6086'

JE saker r Nippie 6100' I.D. - 1.87
Short Strine ---

2 7/8" tubiig A-95 6.5 #/ft $=g Pe-forated Pup 5.85' 6101'

Hydril 6140' Baker R Landing Nipple 6138' s
I,D. = 1,81" 9

il

Perfs: 6155' - 6980'
(Gross Interval)

Nugget 7032: o Eaker F Nipple 6995' I.D. - 1.87

Baker Retrieva D Packer 7016'

2 7/8" tubing N-80 6.5 #/ft
70149 <=- Farfs: 7056' - 7072'

7082'-7098'
2 I T'dtubing (25') Fish [I

,g
f 8820,WBL2:II e6, 02
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FORM s SÌÁTE OF UTAH
FEB 17 1998DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

------ - ase Desig tion and Senal Numben

Dy nF01\ L GASA MINING
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON i -4.lfindian;AllotteeorTribeName:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells.
7. Unit A t Name:

Use APPUCAT1ON FOR PERMIT TO DRILLOR DEEPEN form for such proposais. ,,
. g Amoco "C

1. Type of Wen: OIL GAS OTHER: U. Well Name and Numbec

#1
2. Name of Operator

9. API Well Numben

. AmoonProductionCompany 43-043-30143
3. Address and Telephone Number

10. Field and Pool, of Wildcat
P.O. Box 800, Rm &l2B, Denver, CO 80201 (303) 830-4781 Anschutz Ranch

4. Location of Well

Footages: 866.1' FNL x 527' FWL Summit
County:

00. Sec..T.,R.,M.:
Sec 23, T4N, R7E stas.· Utah

1·
. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

O Abandonment O New Construction O Abandonment O New Construction
O casingRepair O Pull or Alter casing O casingRepair O Pull or After Casing
O Change of Plans O Recompletion O Change of Plans O Shoot or Acidize
O conversionto injection O Shoot or Acidize O conversionto injection O Vent or Flare

Fracture Treat O Vent or Flare O Fracture Treat O Water Shut-Off
O Multiple completion O Water Shut-Off ¡X)Other Plugback
O Other

Date of work completion
Approximate date work will start Repon resuas of MuMpie Completions and Recompiedone to diferent reservoirs on WELL

COMPLEDON OR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form.
* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12. DESCRIBEPROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearty state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and truevertical depths for all magers and,zone; pertinent.to thig woric.)

Amoco Production Company proposes the following procedure:
Shot 4 holes at 4 spf
ROH w/gun (all shots fired)
RIH chemical.cutter & cut tubing off at 6071' leaving 21.81' of tubing above packer
ROH w/wireline.
POOH w/5 tubing pups. 206 jts of 2 3/8" 4.7# CS hydroll tubing & 5.5' cut off stub laying down & lallying.
THI w/2 78" 6.5# N-80 CS Hydrill tubing & HES model "HCS" cement retainer-Tag top of cut off stub at 6071'
prepare to pump cement.
POOH w/tubing putting bottom of retainer at 6054.1l' KB & top of retainer at 6051.98' KB.

N0TE: Verbal approval given by John Baza with Utah state to set cement retainer above A-5 packer & squeeze off
lower perfs for plugback in preperation of sidetrack. Approval given at 13:30 hr on February 9, 1998 via cellular
phone to J. Vern Griffin.

If you require additional information, please contact Gigi Martinez @(303) 830-4781.

This space for State use only)

093) (See instructions on Reverse

FORM s SÌÁTE OF UTAH
FEB 17 1998DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

------ - ase Desig tion and Senal Numben
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County:
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1·
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(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)
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O Multiple completion O Water Shut-Off ¡X)Other Plugback
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Date of work completion
Approximate date work will start Repon resuas of MuMpie Completions and Recompiedone to diferent reservoirs on WELL

COMPLEDON OR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form.
* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12. DESCRIBEPROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearty state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and truevertical depths for all magers and,zone; pertinent.to thig woric.)

Amoco Production Company proposes the following procedure:
Shot 4 holes at 4 spf
ROH w/gun (all shots fired)
RIH chemical.cutter & cut tubing off at 6071' leaving 21.81' of tubing above packer
ROH w/wireline.
POOH w/5 tubing pups. 206 jts of 2 3/8" 4.7# CS hydroll tubing & 5.5' cut off stub laying down & lallying.
THI w/2 78" 6.5# N-80 CS Hydrill tubing & HES model "HCS" cement retainer-Tag top of cut off stub at 6071'
prepare to pump cement.
POOH w/tubing putting bottom of retainer at 6054.1l' KB & top of retainer at 6051.98' KB.

N0TE: Verbal approval given by John Baza with Utah state to set cement retainer above A-5 packer & squeeze off
lower perfs for plugback in preperation of sidetrack. Approval given at 13:30 hr on February 9, 1998 via cellular
phone to J. Vern Griffin.

If you require additional information, please contact Gigi Martinez @(303) 830-4781.

This space for State use only)

093) (See instructions on Reverse
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WELLBOREDIAGRAM
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Form 9 STATE OF UTAH , 5. Lease Designation and Serial
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING Number: Fee

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:
SUNDRY NOTICES ANDREPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existingwells, or to reenter pluggedand abandoned wells 7. Unit Agreement Name:Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for such proposals

1. Type of Well: OIL GAS OTHER
8 Weil Nan enandnNucmbeir:

2. Name of Operator: 9. API Well Number

Amoco Production Company 43-043-30143
3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

P.O. Box 800, Denver, CO 80201 (303) 830-4781 Anchutz Ranch East
4. Location ofWell
Footages: County:
866.1' FNL x 527' FWL Summit
QQ, Sec., T.,R.,M.: State:
NWI4 Sec 23-T4N-R7E Utah
11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit in Duplicate) (SubmitOriginal Form Only)

Abandonment New Construction Abandonment* New Construction
Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing
Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans Shoot or Acidize
Conversion to Injection Shoot or Acidize Conversion to Injection Vent or Flare
Fracture Treat Vent or Flare Fracture Treat Water Shut-Off
Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off Other Plugback - Preparation for Sidetrack
Other

Date of work completion
Approximate date work will start Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirson WELL

COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true
verticaldepths for allmarkers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Verbal approval given by John Baza w/Utah state to set cement retainer above Baker model "A-5" dual string packer
and squeeze off lower perforations for plugback. Well is in preparation for sidetrack. Approval given to cement all tools
below retainer setting & squeeze off perfs. A-5 packer was unable to be retrieved due to being stuck. Approval given on
Feb 9, 1998, 13:30 hr via telephonecall to J. Vern Griffin(Amoco consultant on-site)

Plugged as follows:
2/8/98-Pull 2 7/8" short string tubingout of hole with snap latch. 2/9/98-Cut 2 3/8" long string tubingat 6071', 21.81'
above A-5 packer .

2/10/98-Set Halabartan model "HCS"cement retainer 6051.98' (top). 2/12/98-Pump 410 sx of class
"C" cement with additives. No pressure achieved while pumping. Cleaned retainer with 5/Bbl of water. 2/13/98-Pump
100 sx of class "G" neat cement & 200 sx class "G" wladditives. Achieving no pressure while pumping. Clear retainer
w/5 Bbls of water. 2/14/98- Obtain injection rate thruretainer at 500 psi 2BPM-Mix and pump 50 sx of 10-0 RFC
cement. Spot cement to EOT & string into retainer. Pump 50 sx of 10-0 RFC cement thru retainer obtaining 1150 psi
running squeeze at 1/4BPM. Top out w/20 sx of class "G" cement above retainer. Reverse out remaining cement leaving

ic3

S

gnaturoep 18 '. 2/16/98-ce p tag via tubingat 601A82n2.

Date: 02/24/98

(This space for State use only)

(See Instructions On Reverse
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FEB-23-98 OS:5O From:30778323OO T-578 P.11/13 Job-522

':EMENTING SERVICE REPORT schlumberger R ARE UMBh DAR..

DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER INCORPORATED STAGE DS DISTFyCT

3S-49&A PRINTEDIN u.SA.
// A.-7 , .x.rr i.sf/

VE L fiAME AND NO, LOCATION (t,6GAL) RIG NAME: ' •~ /

/ t-..., 9 2. C- i 2f.- T'?>.!· Ë C- wsu.nava, noroM
__

TOP

lidt.0-POOL & M4MAMON stT 842E CSGet.inerSe

TOTAL DEPTH WEIGHT ,-

COUNTVI AglSM STATh API. NO O ROT O CABLE FOOTAGE ,.

/ A ½ uuo wps enans '
,

¡P
C ,,

TOTAL

AND
MUDVISC. Diep. Capacity

GTE:Include Fontage From aroma I..vel To nees in capaany

annOFSS TYPE TYPE

IP CODg
" DEPTH /• omrTM y

SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS su TYPE TYPE ,
-)

DEPTW DEFTH ,

Head & PIUgs O G SQUEE2EJOB

U Double SizE TYPE /A. « A // rw f

DEPTH

.Swage O GAADE TAi6 PIPE: SizE DEPTH

S CASIN4/TUBI ECunED7 O YES U NO O Knochen O THREAD TUBING VOLUME Ebla

UFT PRESŠÙWE PSI CASINGWEt H14 SUAFACE AREA TOP OR LlW O NEW |USED CASING VOL BELOW TOOL Bbis

PAESSURE LIMIT yd O PSI SUMPPLUGTO PS¡ BOT On OW DEPTH gO $ TOTAL Bois

10TATE RPM RECIPROCATE FT No. of Contralizars ANNUAi. VOLUME ,
Bbis

JOS SCHEDULSD FOR AAnivE ON LOCATION . LGÑLOCATION

TIME
PatsSURE PU PD al. TIME Øyg,Q DATE: ftý TIME:O 4-'> DATE: TIME: fl.' DATE

coot to enco on o P. CASING .......-, -
SERVICE LOG DETAIL

ry ,j

PAEMO6SAFETY MEETING gi ) / . y

asuan s

S M
S

D COMPosmoN OF cEMENTING ËYSTEMS U gNSITY

3.

5.

6.

BREAKOOWN FLulD TYPE VOt.WE DEM6lTY PAESSURE MAR.Às MIN:

O HESITAT10N SQ. RUNNING SO. CIRCULATION LOST ,
D YES $NO Coment CirculatedTo Sul. YES O NO / 5.

BREAKOOWN PSt FINAL PSI DISPLACEMENT VOL. L o ) •¿,
. EbW E

,

OkÓlL D STORAGE ' O BAINEWATER

Washed Thru Perfs O YES U Ñf TO Q.f)(, FT. MEASURED DISPLACEMENT WIAEUNE WELL ,'
GAS O IKIECTION O WILDCAT

PEAFOAATIONS CUSTogER REPRESE-VE DS
.

' SUPERVISOA y' '
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FEB-23-98 08:52 From:3077832300 T-576 P 12/13 Job-522

NENTING SERVICE REPORT ,
Schlumt>e<qar TÎATiàÏÑtþuMMEH

.
.

QATE

DOWELL SCHLUM6ERGER INCORPORATED Aas os,y ofermer
e-A PRINTEDIN U.S.A. / < V.- </2-e.. We, , t

ÑAMEAND .

LOChilON (kEGAL) RIG NAME:

,a.nl 372. | -7/^/

·A 76 wsu.nara:
'

BOTTOM TOP

-POOLÜ FORMAlluN BITSizE CSGA.inerSize

TOTAL DEPTH WEIGMT

JNTYlPARISN STATE APL NU. O ROT O CABLE FOOTAGE

MUD TYPE GRADE

U BMSI THREAD

yr / A.,
CN

TA TOTAL

A
MUD VISC. Disp. Capacity
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Tvpr TYPE
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.. / BWYN / -
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----- x -I
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inM DNATE-
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001 to mana oËD p. CASING W IMMNT
I E SERVICELOGDETAIL
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RKs
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sahad Thru Patia Li YES SNO TO FT. MEASUREDDISPLACEMENT O WIRELINE WELL IN.JECTION O WILOCAT

IRFORATIONS CusTOMER REP ATIVE DS /
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Form 9 ST;rrE OF UTAH 
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 

-
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 

Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for such proposals 

1. Type of Well: OIL D GAS~ OTHERD 

~. Name of Qpera,lor: • 
Amoco Proauctlon Company 

3. Address and Telephone Number: 

P. O. Box 800, Denver CO 80201, Suite 812B 
4. Location of Well 
Footages: 

860' FNL x 536' FWL 
QQ, Sec., T.,R.,M.: 

NW/4 Sec. 23-T4N-R7E 

303-830-4781 

County: 

Summit 
State: 

Utah 

5. Lease Designation and Serial 

Number: FEE 
6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name: 

7. Unit Agreement Name: 

8. Well Name and Number: 

Ch 372 "c" 1 ST #1 
9. API Well Number 

43-043-30143 
10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat: 

Anschutz Ranch 

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 

NOTICE OF INTENT 
(Submit in Duplicate) 

D Abandonment 
D Casing Repair 
D Change of Plans 
D Conversion to Injection 
D Fracture Treat 
D Multiple Completion 
~ Other Sidetrack 

D New Construction 
D Pull or Alter Casing 
D Recompletion 
D Shoot or Acidize 
D Vent or Flare 
D Water Shut-Off 

SUBSEQUENT REPORT 
(Submit Original Form Only) 

D Abandonment* 
D Casing Repair 
D Change of Plans 
D Conversion to Injection 
D Fracture Treat 
D Other 

D New Construction 
D Pull or Alter Casing 
D Shoot or Acidize 
D Vent or Flare 
D Water Shut-Off 

---------------------------------------
Date of work completion 

Approximate date work will start Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL 
------------ COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form . 

• Must be aocompanied by a cement verification report. 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details. and give pertinent dates. If well IS directionally drilled. give subsurface locations and measured and true 

vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.) 

Amoco Production Company proposes to sidetrack the Anschutz Ranch Champlin 372 C-1 well. The well is temporarily abandoned. 

It is proposed to cut a window in the 7",26# casing above 6,020' MD and drill a 6-1/8" hole. The directional plan is to build to horizontal (8 deg/100') 
by the top of the Nugget formation and to drill 1,000' of lateral. 

13. Signatur' . -"-'-'-'''''-.L-_--'-t.'''''-'-../..lt!:!...-....::r--- Title: Regulatory Agent 

APPROVED 
OFUTAt' 
OIL, GA;:'· 

DATE: ~, 
BY: 

(See Instructions On Reverse Side) 

Date: 

\f5)IE~lEllWIE~ 
ill~ MAR 0 5 1998 ill) 
I DlV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING 
, 

Form 9 ME OF UTAH - 5. Lease Designation and Serial
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING Number: FEE

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells 7. Unit Agreement Name:
Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for such proposals

8. Well Name and Number:
1. Type ofWell: OIL GAS OTHER Ch 372 "C" 1 ST #1

9. API Well Numberimarn pre ouition
Company 43-043-30143

3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

P. O. Box 800, Denver CO 80201, Suite 812B 303-830-4781 Anschutz Ranch
4. Location of Well
Footages: County:
860' FNL x 536' FWL Summit
QQ, Sec., T.,R.,M.: State:
NWI4 Sec. 23-T4N-R7E Utah

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT

(Submit in Duplicate) (SubmitOriginal Form Only)

Abandonment New Construction Abandonment* New Construction
Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing
Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans Shoot or Acidize
Conversion to Injection Shoot or Acidize Conversion to Injection Vent or Flare
Fracture Treat Vent or Flare Fracture Treat Water Shut-Off
Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off Other
Other Sidetrack

Date of work completion
Approximate date work will start Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL

COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true
verticaldepths for allmarkers and zones pertinent to thiswork.)

Amoco Production Company proposes to sidetrack theAnschutz Ranch Champlin 372 C-1 well. The well is temporarilyabandoned.

It is proposed to cut a window in the 7", 26# casing above 6,020' MD and drill a 6-1/8" hole. The directional plan is to build to horizontal (8 deg/100')
by the topof the Nugget formation and to drill 1,000' of lateral.

A 4-1/2" liner would be run to the top of the Nugget and cemented to isolate the Twin Creek formation. The Nugget would be completed openhole. A
4-1/2" tiebackstring would be run.

Ifyou require additional information , please contact Gigi Martinez @ (303) 830-4781. WANOF UTAHD • OF01 D IG

13. Signatur /) Title: Regulatory Agent Date:

4this space for State use only)

APPROVED "" T ~

OF UTA
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DATE:
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

(See Instructions On Reverse Side)
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AMOCO

Exploration andProduction Sector
WesternU.S. Business Unit

AmocoBuilding
1670Broadway
PostOInceBox800
Denver,Colorado802014800
aoa-eso.4o4o

March 26, 1998

Mr. Lowell Braxton, Deputy Director/Acting Director
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P. O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

File: CAW-116-986,511

Application for an Exception to the Well Location
Requirements of the Anschutz Ranch Field Spacing Order
Champlin 372 Amoco C 1-ST No. 1
Section 23-T4N-R7E
Anschutz Ranch Field
Summit County, Utah

Amoco ProductionCompanyhereby makes application for administrativeapproval of an
exception to the well location requirements of the Anschutz Ranch Field scacing order.
Enclosed are written consents from all owners of direct and diagonally offsetting drilling
units. We respectively request, in the absenceof any objectionby the Division, that this
application be granted immediately and that the pendingApplication for Permit to Drill
also be approved.

The exception is required for the drillingof the Champlin372 Amoco CL ST No. 1, a
proposedhorizontalwell to be drilled froma surface locationin the NW/1 of Section23-
T4N-R7E to a BHL in the SE/4 of Section 23-T4N-R7E.

Section23-T4N-R7Eis currently spaced on standup 320 acres for both ti Nugget and
Twin Creek Formations. Permitted well locations are 990 feet from the undaries of the
Northwest and Southeast quarters. Lands immediately to the North and Fot of Section
23-T4N-R7E are not spaced and are governed by the General Rules. Ovmership
throughout Section 23 is common.

Amoco proposes to drill the Champlin 372 Amoco C 1-ST No. I, as aNogget test, from a
surfacelocation 544 feet FWL and 866 feet FNL of Section 23-T4N-R7E. vertically to
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depth of approximately 4200 feet and thenturn the well to the southeast towardsa
locationapproximately 1770 feetFWL and 1890 feet FNL of Section 23-T4N-R7E at a
depth of approximately 6500 feetTVD. From this point the well will be drilled
horizontally to an end point of approximately 2775 feet FWL and 2650 feet FNL. At no
point in the projected pay would the well be closer than 990 feet fromthe exterior
boundary of the section,

Dependent upon the results of this well, Amoco may file a subsequentapplicationto
modify the current Nugget spacing to accommodate this horizontal well. In as much as
the required written consents fromoffset owners have been fumishedand given the fact
that ownership throughout Section 23 is commonrespectfully request that this application
be granted.

Attached and made part of this application is the required plat showing the legal location,
the proposed surface and bottomhole location, the location of all current wells and the
ownershipwithin each section.

If you have any question or require additional information please contact myself at (303)
830-4327. Your promptconsideration of this request is appreciated.

Very y

C. A. Wood
Enclosures

cc:

Union Pacific Resources
P. O. Box 7
Fort Worth, TX 76101-0007
Atto: Charles Farmer

Anschutz Corporation
555 17th Street, Suite2400
Denver, CO 80202
Attn: WilliamMiller

B. S. McKim
R. B. Wilson
D.
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CONSENT
CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1-ST NO. 1

The undersigned, as an offsett owner to the proposed Champlin 372 Amoco C 1-ST No.1,
hereby grants consent to the drilling of the Champlin 372 Amoco C 1-ST No. 1 as an
exception to the well location requirements of the Anschutz Ranch Field spacing order.
It is our understanding that this well will be drilled as a hotizontalwell from a surface
location 544 feet FWL and 866 feet FNL of Section 23-T4N-R7E to an approximate
bottomhole location of 2775 feet FWL and 2650 feet FNL of Section 23-T4N-R7E,
Summit County, Utah. Furthermore, it is also our understanding that no point within the
projected pay zone will-bevloser than990 feet from the exterior boundaties of Section
23-T4N-R7E.

Signedby:

Representing! ÛN/0N ÑAd/A Ñ£5edÆtÆJ Û¤NPANY

Date: ÑAActi 19,
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location 544 feet FWL and 866 feet FNL of Section 23-T4N-R7E to an approximate
bottomhole location of 2775 feet FWL and 2650 feet FNL of Section 23-T4N-R7E,
Summit County, Utah. Furthermore, it is also our understanding that no point within the
projected pay zone will-bevloser than990 feet from the exterior boundaties of Section
23-T4N-R7E.

Signedby:

Representing! ÛN/0N ÑAd/A Ñ£5edÆtÆJ Û¤NPANY

Date: ÑAActi 19,
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PROPOSED PROCEDURE
ANSCHUTZ RANCH CHAMPLIN 372 Cl ST#1

SEC 23-T4N-R7E
SUMMIT COUNTY, UTAH

Amoco Production Company plans to sidetrack the C-1 well to the Nugget formation
using the following procedure:

1. Cut window in existing 7", 26# casing above 6,020' MD.
2. Build angle at approximately 8 degrees/100' until reaching 90 degrees of wellbore

inclination at the top of the Nugget formation (7,500' MD; 6,556' TVD).
3. Hold 90 degree inclination at 130 degrees azimuth for 1000' (8,500' MD total depth)

in the Nugget.
4. Log openhole interval.
5. Run 4-1/2" liner to the top of the Nugget at 7,500' MD/6,556' TVD and cement with

95 sx utilizing an external casing packer and diverter tool. TOL will be approximately
5650' MD.

6. Clean out to TOL and pressure test to 1500 psi. Clean out 4-1/2" liner.
7. RIH with 4-1/2" tieback string and sting into liner top.
8. Perform acid stimulation to remove near wellbore damage in the Nugget openhole

interval.

The existing well has been temporarily abandoned after an extended period of shut-in as a
Twin Creek/Nugget dual completion.

The well will be sidetracked to the Nugget reservoir to restore production from this
wellbore.
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WELLBORE DIAGRAM
Field: Anschutz Ranch

Fbb¾, †998 Well: CH 372 C #1
SEC: 23 TWP: 4N RGE: 7E

KBCorrection: 16.70'

- DESCRIPTION- TOOLS RUN - ETC. DEPTHKB

Ingram Cactus 11" 3M By 7" 5M w/R2 bottom & 6" bore C bowl, tubing spool
(re-conditionedby Cameron ) (7" 26# casing stub landed in slips)

7" 26# K-55 ST & C cut off csg stub 12.66' 16.70'
to

29.36'

9 5/8" 32.3# H-40 GT & C csg set at 1518' -

Cement top7" per CBLon 2/15/98
logged by Schlumberger at 4906' + - 29.36'

7" 23# K-55 ST & C casing - 4974.2T to
5003.63'

7"26# S-95 & K-55 casing - 2296.62' 5003.63'
to

7300.25'
NOTE:
TWInCreek & Nugget squeezed off as follows,
2/12/98 pumped 410 sx "G" + additives no pressure MIN MAX
2/13/98 pumped 100 sx "G" neat & 200 sx "G" + additives
no pressure Cement cap at 6018.22' - tagged via tbg
2/14/98 pumped 50sx 10-0 RFC and obtain1150 psi squeeze
2/14/98 pump 20 sx "G" for topoutcmt cap on top of retainer Halliburton Model "HCS" cement retainer 5.5" 6051.98'

(set via tbg - Bottom at 6054.11')

Cut off 2 3/8" 4.7# N-80 CS hydril tbg 1.901" 2.375• 6071'

X-Over: 2 3/8" CS to 2 3/8" Brd 1.901• 3.062• 6089.49'
Spacer tube 1.901" 2.375" 6090.29

Baker model A-5 dual packer 1.901" 6.093• 6092.81'
Spacer tube, sholt strinq:
Spacer tube, X-over, 2 3/8" pup, Model "E" hyd Spacer tube 1.901" 2.376• 6098.13'tripsub, 2 3/8" pup, Model "F" nipple, PerPd pup, X-Over: 2 3/8" to 2 3/8" 10rd to Brd 1.901 2.875• 6099.43'
i Jt2 3/8" tbg, Baker model"R" nipple, Mule shoe X-Over 2 3/8" to 2 7/8" Brd 1.901 3.00• 6099.75'
Avg OD's & ID's: ID 1.901" & OD 2.92" ..

'
. Perfd tubing: 4 shots (4 spf) 6103.5T

Overall length: 48.73'
EOT at 6141.54'

29 jts of2 7/8" 6.5#8rd tbg 2.441" 3.668" 6100.07
Tbg collars: 3.668" - Tube: 2 875"

Twin Creek Perfs:
6155' thru 6980'

Baker Model "F" nipple 1.87" 3.6875" 6994.86'
i jt of 2 7/8" 6.5#8rd tbg 2.441" 3.668" 6995.8T
Baker model G-22 locator assembly 2.406" 3.46875• 7023.95'
Baker model "retrieva D" packer 3.25" 6.093"

Baker model 80-32 seal assembly 2 406" 2.688• 7036.66.
X-Over 2 3/8" 10rd BX by BX f 906" 3.067 7037.09'

- X-Over: 2 3/8" NU to EU 1.906" 3.067 7037.46'
1 jt of 2 3/8" EU Srd 1 90f 3.067 7069.12'Nua6aetPerfs BMakermodel "R" nipple 760" T 89'

FISH: 2 3/8" tbg (25') PBTD:

7 3# at 7300.25'

&
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AMOCO PRODUCTION COMPANY
ANSCHUTZ RANCH FIELD

DRILLING PROGRAM - NUGGET SIDETRACK

Amoco Production Company Attachment to Sundry Notice

Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C-1 Field: Anschutz Ranch

BH (Target) Location: 2642' FNL & 2766' FWL, (NW/4 SE/4), Section 23, T4N, R7E
Surface Location: 860' FNL & 536' FWL, (NW/4 NW/4), Section 23, T4N, R7E

Summit County, Utah

1. The Geologic Surface Formation:

The surface formation is the Wasatch Formation.

2. Estimated Tops of Important Geologic Markers:

Estimated KB = 23' Ground Level = 7,001' KB Elevation = 7,024'

FORMATION MD TVD SUBSEA

Twin Creek 5,388' 5,312' 1,697'
Leeds Creek 6,040' 5,840' 1,169'
Watton Canyon 6,280' 6,138' 871'
Boundary Ridge 6,620' 6,249' 760'
Rich 6,700' 6,311' 698'
Slide Rock 7,090' 6,490' 519'
Gypsum Springs 7,295' 6,543' 465'
Nugget 7,500' 6,556' 453'
TOTAL DEPTH 8,500' 6,560' 449'

3. Estimated True Vertical Depths (Tops & Bottoms) of Anticipated Water, Oil, Gas, or Minerals;
Operators Plans for Protection.

Nugget 6,556'-7,500' TVD Oil/Gas* Twin Creek will be cased and cemented to isolate the Nugget.

* Currently being produced in the Anschutz Ranch Field.

• Casing will be tested to 0.22 psi/ft. or 1500 psi, whichever is greater, but not exceed 70% of
the minimum yield.

• Casinghead 9 5/8" x l1" 3,000 psi WP
• Tubinghead 11" 3M x 7-1/16" x 5,000 psi WP

MAR05 1998
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4. Proposed Casing and Cementing Programs - Re-entry

Hole Size Setting Depth Section Size (OD) Wt. , Grade New/Used
(Interval MD) Length and Joint

6-1/8" O'-5,650' 5,650' 4-½" (tieback) 12.60# N-80 Used
VAM

6-1/8" 5,650'-8,500' 2,850' 4-1/2" (liner) 12.6# N-80 Used
VAM

Casing Design Factors:

Tension Collapse Burst

4-½" tieback 5.46 2.80 3.37
4-1/2" liner 2.71 2.50 20.23

Cement Program:

4-1/2" Production Liner: 5,650' - 8,500' MD (250' overlap into 7" intermediate casing).

Liner Cement: 95 sx Class G + 2% D20 (extender) + 0.3% D65 (Dispersant) + 0.35% D153 (anti-
settling) + 0.1% D800 (Retarder) + 1.75 gps D600 (fluid loss) + 0.1 gps Dl35 (deflocculant) + .05

gps M45 (anti-foaming).

Yield = 1.36 ft'/sk, Wt = 14.8 ppg, Excess = 20%

Estimated top of cement will be at 5,650' MD. Actual volumes will be based on the four (4) arm
caliper volume with 20% excess.

The following shall be entered in the Driller's log:

1. Blowout preventer pressure tests, including test pressures and results
2. Blowout preventer tests for proper functioning
3. Blowout prevention drills conducted
4. Casing run, including size, grade, weight, and depth set
5. How the pipe was cemented, including amount of cement, type, whether cement circulated,

location of the cementing tools, etc.
6. Waiting on cement (WOC) time for each casing string
7. Casing pressure tests after cementing, including test pressure and results
8. Slow pump rate and pressure

5. The Operator's Minimum Specifications for Pressure Control

Attached is a schematic diagram of the blowout preventer equipment. A 5,000 psi system will be
installed, maintained, used and tested in accordance with all requirements specified in Section III.A -

of Onshore Order 2, except where variations are presented in this application.

Minimum standards outlined in Onshore Order 2 will be met for BOP, choke manifold, accumulator
system and power for closing unit and locking devices. The accumulator and master hydraulic
controls will be 100-200 feet from the drill hole. Remote hydraulic controls will be located on the rig
floor. Manual controls will be handwheels. The kill line will n<g be used as a fill-up line.
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Ram type preventers and associated equipment (choke manifold, kelly cocks, etc.) shall be pressure
tested to 100% of their rated working pressure (with BOP stack isolated from casing by a test plug) for
a period of 10 minutes. Annular preventers shall be tested to 50% of rated working pressure for 10
minutes. Tests will be run after initial installation, prior to drilling out of each casing shoe and after
any use under pressure, or a minimum of once every 30 days.

Operational function tests will be conducted as follows: pipe rams each 24 hour period; pipe and blind
rams on each trip with pipe out of the hole; and annular preventer at least weekly. Such checks of
BOPE will be noted on daily drilling reports.

Pressure tests are required before drilling out from under all casing strings set and cemented in place.
Blowout preventer controls must be installed prior to drilling the casing plug and will remain in use
until the well is completed or abandoned. Preventers will be inspected at least daily to insure good
mechanical working order and this inspection recorded on the daily drilling report. Preventers will be
pressure tested before drilling casing cement plugs.

6. The Type and Characteristics of the Proposed Circulating Muds

There will be enough mud materials on site to displace the hole at any time.

Measured Depth Type Weight #/Gal. Viscosity Sec/Qt. Fluid Loss

6,000' - 8,500' FW Organic Polymer 8.4 - 8.7 40 - 55 3-5 cc's

After mudding up, the slow pump rate and pressure will be recorded on the daily drilling report.
Mud tests shall be performed every 24 hours to determine, as applicable, density, viscosity, gel
strength, filtration, and pH.

7. The Auxiliary Equipment to be Used

1. An upper kelly cock valve will be kept in the string
2. A full opening stabbing valve with subs will be on the floor to be stabbed into the drill pipe

when the kelly is not in the string
3. Pit level monitors, audio and visual indicators will be installed
4. Gas Buster

8. The Testing, Logging and Coring Programs to be followed

1. No drillstem tests are anticipated or planned
2. The logging program will consist of the following:

Array Induction/DEN/NEUT/GR 5" TD - KOP
3. No cores will be taken
4. Completion Program: The Nugget will be completed openhole with an acid stimulation .

9. Any Anticipated Abnormal Pressures or Temperatures

No abnormal pressures or temperatures are anticipated. Bottom hole pressure is anticipated to be
2400± psi at 6,556' (TVD). Bottomhole temperature will be ± 150°F.

No Hydrogen Sulfide should be present in the Nugget Formation.
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10. Anticipated Starting Date and Duration of the Operations

The anticipated starting date is April 1, 1998, or as soon as possible after the rig finishes the ARE
W29-04 sidetrack. Operations will cover 45 days for drilling and 5 days for completion.

Clean up may take up to one year, depending upon the weather.

Verbal and/or written notifications listed below shall be submitted in accordance with the Utah Oil
and Gas Conservation Commission:

1. Prior to beginning construction.
2. Spud date will be reported orally to the Authorized Officer within 24 hours after spudding.
3. Notify Authorized Officer 24 hours prior to running any casing, cementing or BOP tests
4. Prior to plugging the well, for verbal plugging instructions. Unless the plugging is to take

place immediately upon receipt of oral approval, the Authorized Officer must be notified at
least 24 hours in advance of he plugging of the well, in order that a representative may
witness the plugging operation.

5. Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents or other unusual occurrences shall be reported to the
appropriate office immediately.
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Anschutz Ranch Field
Champlin 372 C-1 ST #1

Northmouth East-west
IAD IneUnntion Azimuth TVD Departute Departure ConWhento

O O 0 0 0 0 Original Wellbore
1542 1.4 326 1,542 16 -11

1640 1.6 296 1,640 17 -12

1740 1.7 302 1,740 19 -15

1840 2.1 285 1,840 20 -18

1940 1.9 290 1,940 21 -21

2040 2.8 278 2,040 22 -25

2140 2.4 283 2,139 23 -30

2240 2.8 283 2,239 24 -34

2340 2.1 303 2,339 25 -38

2440 2.4 301 2,439 27 -41

2540 2.6 297 2,539 29 -45

2640 2.5 286 2,639 31 -49

2740 2.4 282 2,739 32 -53

2840 2.3 292 2,839 33 -57

2940 2.3 295 2,939 35 -61

3040 2.4 288 3,039 36 -65

3140 2.5 279 3,139 37 -69

3240 2 290 3,238 38 -73

3340 2.4 282 3,338 39 -77

3440 2 285 3,438 40 -80

3540 2.4 289 3,538 41 -84

3640 2 200 3,638 40 -86

3740 3.5 166 3,738 36 -86

3840 3.4 171 3,838 30 -85

3940 4 138 3,938 24 -82

4040 7.4 129 4,037 18 -75

4140 9.8 128 4,136 8 -63

4240 13.7 118 4,234 -2 -46

4340 15.3 104 4,331 -11 -23

4440 15.5 111 4,427 -19 2
4540 16.5 124 4,523 -32 27
4640 18.7 127 4,619 -49 51
4740 20 129 4,713 -70 77
4840 21.2 131 4,807 -93 104
4940 22.1 127 4,900 -116 133
5040 22.5 114 4,992 -135 165
5140 23.4 107 5,084 -148 202
5240 23.4 123 5,176 -165 238
5340 23.8 126 5,268 -188 271
5388 23.9 127 5,312 -199 286
5440 24 128 5,359 -212 303
5540 22.5 132 5,451 -237 333
5640 21.3 130 5,544 -262 361
5740 20.1 129 5,637 -284 389

Amoco Production
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Anschutz Ranch Field
Champlin 372 C-1 ST #1

North•south Eastet
WID inclinaßen Azimuth TVD Deparbare Departure Comments

5840 20.4 130 5,731 -306 415
5940 21.4 129 5,825 -329 443 Kick Off Point
6000 25 129 5,880 -344 461
6100 33 129 5,967 -374 499
6200 41 129 6,047 -412 546
6300 49 129 6,118 -457 601
6400 57 129 6,178 -507 663
6500 65 129 6,226 -562 730
6600 65 129 6,269 -619 801
6700 65 129 6,311 -676 871
6800 65 129 6,353 -733 942
6900 65 129 6,395 -790 1,012
7000 65 129 6,438 -847 1,083
7100 65 129 6,480 -904 1,153
7200 73 129 6,516 -963 1,226
7300 81 129 6,538 -1,024 1,301
7500 89 129 6,556 -1,149 1,456 Top of Nugget
8000 90 129 6,560 -1,464 1,844
8500 90 130 6,560 -1,782 2,230

Amoco Production
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SURFACE USE PROGRAM TO ACCOMPANY APD

Attached to Form OGC-1A
Amoco Production Company
Well Name: Anschutz Ranch Field Champlin 372 C-1 S.T. #1
Location: NWINW Sec. 23-T4N-R7E
County: Summit State: Utah

1. Existing Roads

a. The proposed well site location map, elevation plat. Cut and fill
diagram, and cross sections are shown as EXHIBIT "A".

b. From the Amoco Production Office in Evanston, Wyoming take
Overthrust Road south. Go 16.7 miles to the Amoco Anschutz
Ranch Plant. From the Plant to the water ponds, travelwest
another 1.7 miles. Then take Road #4, 4.6 miles to the Anschutz
Ranch Champlin 372 C-1 lease (goright at the "Y"past the cabin at
+/- 3.5 miles).

c. The rig layout is shown in EXHIBIT "B". AIIroads to the location
are shown on EXHIBIT "C".

d. The existing roads need no improvement. Existing roads willbe
maintained in the same or better condition.

2. Planned Access Roads

No new access road is required. After completion of the well, the road
willbe restored to its original condition.

3. Location of Existinq Wells

a. One water well has been permitted within a one mile radius of this
location.

b. There is one water disposal well within a one mile radius.

c. There are three producing wells (all currently shut-in) within this
one mile radius. AIIare producing from either the Twin Creek or
Nugget formations.

d. There are no injection wells within a one mile
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4. Location of Existing and/or Proposed Facilities to be used ifWell is
Productivity

a. This is a re-entry of an existing wellbore. The production facilities
will continue to be utilized as in the past.

b. Rehabilitation of all pad areas not used for production facilities will
be made in accordance with the State of Utah and the surface
landowner.

c. Production facilities will remain in the same location as they are
currently placed on the pad.

d. AIIoff-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or
commingling on-lease or off-lease will have prior approval from the
State of Utah Oil and Gas Commission.

5. Location and Type of Water Supply

a. Water for drilling will be trucked in from ARE #21-04 fresh water
well by area contractors.

b. Water will be provided by Amoco from the ARE #21-04 water well
located in Sec. 21-T4N-R8E. This is a water well operated by the
Anschutz Ranch East Plant.

c. No water well is to be drilled for this location.

6. Construction Materials

a. No construction materials are needed for drilling the well or
constructing access roads into the location during drilling. If any
surface materials are necessary, they willbe provided by the dirt
contractor.

b. No construction or surfacing materials will be taken from any
land.

c. Ifwell is productive and additional materials are required for road
or pad, these materials will be provided by the dirt
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7. Handling of Water Materials and Disposal

a. Drillcuttings willbe buried in the reserve pit.

b. Drillingfluids will be allowed to evaporate in the reserve pit or
truckedto approved disposal site.

c. Any fluids produced during drilling tests or while making production
tests will be collected in a test tank. No oilwillbe placed in the
reserve pit. Any spills of oil, gas, salt water, or other noxious fluids
will be cleaned up and removed. Ifwell is productive, produced
water willbe disposed of by truckingto the Anschutz Ranch East
SWD facility.

d. Portable chemical toiletswill be provided. No sewage will be left on
site.

e. Garbage and non-flammable trash willbe disposed of in portable
trash cage and hauled to nearest land fill. Drillfluids, drillingmud
and tailingwillbe kept in the reserve pit. Reserve pit willbe fenced
on three sides during drilling and the fourth side fenced upon
removal of the rig.

f. After the rig moves out, all materials willbe cleaned up and no
adverse materials will be left on location. AIIdangerous open pits
will be fenced during drilling and kept closed until the pit is leveled.

8. Ancillary Facilities

No air strip, camp or other facilitieswillbe built during drillingofthis
well.

9. Well Site Layout

a. EXHIBIT "A"is the drill pad layout as staked by Uinta Engineering
of Evanston, Wyoming. Cuts and fills have been drafted to
represent the planned cut across the location and the pit.

b. EXHIBIT "B" is a diagram of the proposed rig layout. No permanent
living facilities are planned. There willbe trailerson site for the
Amoco Drilling Foreman, Rig Tool Pusher, Mud Engineer,
Directional Engineer and Mud Loggers.

c. The reserve pit willbe lined (12
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d. A flare pit willbe located as shown on EXHIBIT "A".
No fluids willbe allowed to accumulate in the flare pit.

10. Plans for Reclamation of the Surface

a. Ifwell is abandoned, site willbe restored to original condition as
nearly as possible. Backfilling, leveling and contouring willbegin as
soon as all pits have dried. Waste disposal and spoils materials will
be buried or hauled away to an approved sanitary landfill
immediately after drilling is completed. If production is obtained, the
unused area of the drill pad will be restored as soon as possible.

b. The site will be ripped prior to replacing the topsoil.The soil-
banked material will be spread over the area. Re-vegetation will be
accomplished by planting mixed grasses as per the landowners
specifications.

c. Three sides of the reserve pit willbe fenced during drilling
operations. Prior to rig release, the fourth side willbe fenced to
prevent livestock or wildlifefrom entering; and the fencing willbe
maintained until leveling and cleanup are accomplished. Excess
oily substances should be removed from the reserve pit within 30
days to aid evaporation.

d. If any oil is on the pit and is not immediately removed, the pit will
be flagged overhead or covered with wire mesh.

e. The reclamation operations will begin immediately after the drilling
rig is removed. Removal of oilor other adverse substance will
begin immediately or the area willbe flagged and fenced. Other
cleanup willbe done as needed. It is estimated that reclamation
operations willbe completed by Fall 1998, depending upon
weather conditions.

11. Surface Ownership

Surface at the well site is private property owned by the Castle Rock Land
and Livestock Company. President is David Allen.

Amoco has negotiated a surface damage agreement with the surface land
owner for the NWl4 NWl4 of Section 23. AIIof the pad lies on this Fee
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12. Other Information

The primary surface use is for grazing.

The complete copy of the approved Application for Permit to Drill (APD),
including conditions and stipulations, shall be at the well site during
construction and drilling operations. A copy shall also be furnished to the
dirt contractor.

There willbe no deviation from the proposed drilling and/or workover
program without prior approval from the State of Utah Oil and Gas
Commission office. Safe drilling and operating practices must be
observed. A Notice of Intent to Abandon must be submitted for
abandonment approval if the well is a dry hole.

This permit shall be valid for a period of one (1) year from the date of
approval. After permit expiration, a new application will be filed for
approval of any future operations.

13. Lessee's or Operator's Field Representative

MAILAPPROVED APD TO:

Gigi Martinez
Amoco Production Company

THROUGH APD APPROVAL: 1670 Broadway, #812B
Denver, Colorado 80202

BillMurphy (303) 830-4781

Production Foreman
Amoco Production
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Form 9 STATE OF UTAH 5. Lease Designation and Serial
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING Number: FEE

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells 7. Unit Agreement Name:

Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for such proposals

8. Well Name and Number:
1. Type of Well: OIL GAS OTHER Ch 372 Amoco "C" 1

9. API Well NumberiŠoiO"ro$°uition
Company 43-043-30143

3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

P. O. Box 800, Denver CO 80201, Suite 812B 303-830-4781 Anschutz Ranch
4. Location of Well
Footages: County:
860' FNL x 536' FWL Summit
QQ, Sec., T.,R.,M.: State:
NWI4 Sec. 23-T4N-R7E Utah

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

Abandonment New Construction Abandonment* New Construction
Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing
Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans Shoot or Acidize
Conversion to Injection Shoot or Acidize Conversion to Injection Vent or Flare
Fracture Treat Vent or Flare Fracture Treat Water Shut-Off
Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off Other
Other Change Name

Date of work completion

Approximate date work willstart Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and givepertinent dates. Ifwell is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true
vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Amoco Production Company plans to change the well name of Champlin372 Amoco "C" #1 to Champlin 372 Amoco "C" 1 Sidetrack #1. Please
change your records accordingly.

If you require additional information, please contact Gigi Martinez at (303) 830-4781.

13. Signature Title: Regulatory Agent Date:

(This space for State use only)
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'- WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 03/05/98 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-043-30143

WELL NAME: CH 372 "C" 1 ST #1
OPERATOR: AMOCO PRODUCTION (NOO50)

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATION BY: 03/20/98
NWNW 23 - TO4N - RO7E
SURFACE: 0860-FNL-0536-FWL TECH REVIEW Initials Date
BOTTOM: 2642-FNL-2766-FWL

SUMMIT COUNTY Engineering *Û$$ 3 #6
ANSCHUTZ RANCH FIELD (500) /

Geology
LEASE TYPE: FEE
LEASE NUMBER: ANSCHUTZ RANCH Surface

PROPOSED PRODUCING FORMATION: NGSD

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

Plat R649-2-3. Unit:
'Bond: Federal [] State [] Fee B

¯¯

(Number Rµ?ad §odup) R649-3-2. General.
Potash (Y/N)
Oil shale (Y/N) R649-3-3. Exception.

/ Water permit
(Nurber Ñ¿¿ þ //-V ) / Drilling Unit.

RDCC Review (Y/N) Board Cause no: /83-/
(Date: ) Date: 26-TutV 74

COMMENTS:

STIPULATIONS: Ay, px AG (
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OPERATOR: AMOCO PRODUCTION (NOO50)

FIELD: ANSCHUTZ RANCH (500)

SEC. 23, TWP. 4N, RNG. 7E,

COUNTY: SUMMIT UAC: ORDER183-1 26-JULY-79

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS & MINING

ANSCHUTZ RANCH
(WEBER)

ANSCHUTZ RANCH

XXXXX

ANSCH TZ RANCH EAST

DATEPREPARED:

OPERATOR: AMOCO PRODUCTION (NOO50)

FIELD: ANSCHUTZ RANCH (500)

SEC. 23, TWP. 4N, RNG. 7E,

COUNTY: SUMMIT UAC: ORDER183-1 26-JULY-79

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS & MINING

ANSCHUTZ RANCH
(WEBER)

ANSCHUTZ RANCH

XXXXX

ANSCH TZ RANCH EAST

DATEPREPARED:



DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

STATEMENT OF BASIS

Operator Name: Amoco Production Company

Name & Number: Ch 372 "C" 1 St #1 Reentry

API Number: 43-043-30143

Location: 1/4,1/4 NW NW Sec. 23 T. 4 N R. 7 E

Geology/Ground Water:

The purfage casing existing in thip well will be sufficient to provide protection to the negg
purface waterg gegng in this gree. It is an area of recharqq to 19ep1 aquiferp ang ;i,g a waterghed
gree for the Weber River Dreingge, by way of Reese Çreek through Echo Çanyen. Regge Çggek hop
getive water flow all year rowng and is within ½ mile of this 19eggion. No mq¢ifiggtien to the
existing surface gewing is planned for this well and ne known ground water hgg ever been
enequntered while grilling.

Reviewer: K. Michael Hebertson

Date: 20-March-1998

Surface:

A propeged flare pit adiacent to the exigging tank bettery weg ebenged te a flare yteek by the
operator, and a proposed road reconstruction was avoided. The reë4 is little 9094 gyring any
portien of the year gng will not be neç494 guring the grilling eperatieng . Pipelineg ynder tþe
location will not be diggyrbe4 existing surface facilities are not going to þa a problem with
tþip operation. Berms at the tog of the gut and fill plopen and glong the top of the ),9cation to
reduce the chancep og gyngff entering Regge Creek were dipeupsed. Old pit cuttings and fluid may
be enegyntered while diqqing the new pit. This material will be ençappyletog on the loggtion in
the old flare pit. A peggible geil analygig of this may be necegpary gg it may contain galt

gatyrsteg evttings. Verbal approval weg given to start the dirt work.

Reviewer: K. Michael Hebertson

Date: 20-March-1998

Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill:
1. Berm at the toe of the cut slope.
2. Berm at the toe of the fill slope.
3. Berm around the top outside edge of the location pad.
4. A 12 Mils pit liner.
5. Old pit material will be stored on location pending future testing and
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State of Utah -

On-Site Evaluation
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

OPERATOR: Amoco Production Company
WELL NAME & NUMBER: CH 372 "C" 1 ST #1 Reentry
API NUMBER: 43-043-30143

LEASE: Fee FIELD/UNIT: Anschutz Ranch
LOCATION: 1/4,1/4 NW NW Sec: 23 TWP: 4N RNG: 7E 860 FNL 536 FWL
LEGAL WELL SITING: F SEC. LINE; F 1/4,1/4 LINE; F ANOTHER WELL.

GPS COORD (UTM): Existing location
SURFACE OWNER: Castle Rock Land & Livestock

PARTICIPANTS:
Mike Hebertson State of Utah, Clark Lawler AMOCO, Gordon Lindley

Lindley Construction, John Rich Lindley Construction

REGIONAL/LOCAL SETTING & TOPOGRAPHY:
Overthrust Belt dominated by moderately steep hills and moderately
incised secondary drainages along Reese Creek.

SURFACE USE PLAN:

CURRENT SURFACE USE: This is an established well pad, located within
the confines of an active cattle ranch.

PROPOSED SURFACE DISTURBANCE: This area is already a well pad, however
the pad will be expanded to accommodate the rig, and another 1.3 acres

will be involved in the new portion.

LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHIN A 1 MILE RADIUS: One well in Section

14 (Weber completion), one well NESE in this same section, and a well
well in section 22 (Twin Creek completion)

LOCATION OF PRODUCTION FACILITIES AND PIPELINES: Pipelines and other
facilities are already in place.

SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL: Spoil from the expansion of the
existing pad. A gravel cap will be placed on the pad with material
purchased from the Anschutz Ranch Field gravel pit.

ANCILLARY FACILITIES: None will be needed that do not already exist.

WASTE MANAGEMENT PLAN:
All trash garbage and refuse will be placed in wire mesh containers

and transported to an approved land fill. All human waste will be
contained in portable septic tank or chemical toilet type facilities.
Drill cuttings will be contained in the reserve
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ENVIRONMENTAL PARAMETER

AFFECTED FLOOD PLAINS AND/OR WETLANDS: None, However the location is
about ½ mile from Reese Creek which flows water all year round.

FLORA/FAUNA: Deer, Elk, Moose, Cougar, Eagles, Hawks, Other indigenous
bird species, Aspen, Pine, varieties of grasses, Sage Brush, Rabbit

Brush other intermontain flora and fauna.

SOIL TYPE AND CHARACTERISTICS: Mostly clay with very little sand, lots
Of small rocks to larger pit run type gravel and head sized rocks.

SURFACE FORMATION & CHARACTERISTICS: Wasatch Formation Clay with
numerous rocks light gray to medium brown in color. Minor sand and
Topsoil. Moderate to Poor Permeability.

EROSION/SEDIMENTATION/STABILITY: Location is stable and shows no
erosion, cut and fill slopes show good stability with little or no
erosion. Some sedimentation will occur at the toe of the cut and fill
slopes.

PALEONTOLOGICAL POTENTIAL: None

RESERVE PIT:

CHARACTERISTICS: 160 X 60 X 12 Feet deep located on the North side of
the location is cut material. The pit will be lined.

LINER REQUIREMENTS (Site Ranking Form attached): See attached

SURFACE RESTORATION/RECLAMATION PLAN:
The restoration for this site will be as agreed to in the executed
Agreement which was viewed at the pre-site.

SURFACE AGREEMENT: Has been executed and will cover the restoration.

CULTURAL RESOURCES/ARCHAEOLOGY: None

OTHER OBSERVATIONS/COMMENTS:

A copy of the surface use agreement was provided at the onsite and is
is recorded with the appropriate government agencies.

ATTACHMENTS:
Photos were taken of this site and will be placed on file.

K. Michael Hebertson 20-March-1998 11:00 AM
DOGM REPRESENTATIVE
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Evaluatiod Ranking Criteria and Rankii'g Score
For Reserve and Onsite Pit Liner Requirements

Site-Specific Factors Ranking Site Rankina

Distance to Groundwater (feet)
>200 0
100 to 200 5
75 to 100 10
25 to 75 15
<25 or recharge area 20 0

Distance to Surf. Water (feet)
>1000 0
300 to 1000 2
200 to 300 10
100 to 200 15
< 100 20 10

Distance to Nearest Municipal Well (feet)
>5280 0
1320 to 5280 5
500 to 1320 10
<500 15 0

Distance to Other Wells (feet)
>1320 0
300 to 1320 10
<300 20 0

Rative Soil Type
Low permeability 0
Mod. permeability 10
High permeability 20 5

Fluid Type
Air/mist 0
Fresh Water 5
TDS >5000 and <10000 15
TDS >10000 or Oil Base 20
Mud Fluid containing high
levels of hazardous constituents 5

Drill Cuttings
Normal Rock 0
Salt or detrimental 10 0

Annual Precipitation (inches)
<10 0
10 to 20 5
>20 10 10

Affected Populations
<10 0
10 to 30 6
30 to 50 8
>50 10 9

Presence of Nearby Utility
Conduits

Not Present 0
Unknown 10
Present 15 10

Final Score (Level II Sensitivity)
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03/23/98
JRB

CASING AND CEMENTINGEVALUATION
FOR APD APPROVAL

Well Name(s): Ch 372 "C" 1 St #1
Operator Name: Amoco Production Co.

Proposed TD (feet): 6,560 TVD 8,500 MD
Production casing setting depth: 6,556 TVD 7,500 MD
Mud Type at TD: Fresh waterlorganic polymer
Mud Weight at TD (ppg): 8.7
Anticipated BHP (psi): 2400

Calculated BHP at TD (psi): 2968
Calculated BHP at production casing depth (psi): 2966
Calculated Surface Pressure (psi): 1525

Production String Casing Design

Diameter (inches): 4.50 Note: This appears to be tubing with
Weight (Ib/ft): 12.60 premium thread connection.
Grade: N-80
Thread Type: VAM

Collapse Strength (psi): 7500 Note: These strengths are for new
Internal Yield Strength (psi): 8430 pipe. Operator plans on using
Joint Strength (Ib): 208,700 used material.

Calculated Collapse SF: 2.53 Collapse safety factor should exceed 1.125
Calculated Burst SF: 2.84 Burst safety factor should exceed 1.10
Calculated Tension SF: 2.21 Tension safety factor should exceed 1.80

Insert and copy block as necessary for intermediate or swiace casing strings

Production String Cementing Program

Casing Diameter (inches): 4.50
Hole Diameter (inches): 6.125

Single Stage
Cement Type: Class G
Cement Volume (sx): 95
Cement Yield (cu.ft.lsk): 1.36
Annular Volume (cu.ft.llin.ft.): 0.0942
Excess Percentage: 0.20
Anticipated Coverage Height (ft): 1850

Calculated Coverage Height (ft): 1143 Calculated value should exceed anticipated amount.

Second Stage NA
Cement Type:
Cement Volume (sx):
Cement Yield (cu.ft.lsk):
Annular Volume (cu.ft.llin.ft.):
Excess Percentage:
Anticipated Coverage Height (ft):

Calculated Coverage Height (ft): ERR Calculated value should exceed anticipated
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03/23/98
JRB

Surface String Cementing Program

Casing Diameter (inches): NA
Hole Diameter (inches):
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O Sta~te of UtahDEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCESDIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
1594 West North Temple, Suite.1210Michael O. Leavitt
PO Box 145801Governor

Ted Stewart Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801
Executive Director 801-538-5340
Lowell P. Braxton 801-359-3940 (Fax)
Division Director 801-538-7223 (TDD)

March 26, 1998

Amoco Production Company
P.O. Box 800, Suite 812B
Denver, Colorado 80201

Re: Ch 372 "C" 1 ST #1 Well, 860' FNL, 536' FWL, NW NW, Sec. 23,T. 4 N., R. 7 E., Summit County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah CodeAnn. 40-6-1 et seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq.,and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill thereferenced well is granted.

Administrative approval of Amoco's request for an exceptionlocation is hereby granted on the condition that if the well isproductive from the horizontal wellbore, Amoco agrees to comebefore the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining seeking appropriatespacing.

This approval shall expire one year from the above dateunless substantial and continuous operation is underway, or arequest for extension is made prior to the expiration date. TheAPI identification number assigned to this well is 43-043-30143.

ohn R. Baza
Associate Director

lwp
Enclosures '
cc: Summit County Assessor

Bureau of Land Management, State
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Ted Stewart Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801
Executive Director 801-538-5340
Lowell P. Braxton 801-359-3940 (Fax)
Division Director 801-538-7223 (TDD)

March 26, 1998

Amoco Production Company
P.O. Box 800, Suite 812B
Denver, Colorado 80201

Re: Ch 372 "C" 1 ST #1 Well, 860' FNL, 536' FWL, NW NW, Sec. 23,T. 4 N., R. 7 E., Summit County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah CodeAnn. 40-6-1 et seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq.,and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill thereferenced well is granted.

Administrative approval of Amoco's request for an exceptionlocation is hereby granted on the condition that if the well isproductive from the horizontal wellbore, Amoco agrees to comebefore the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining seeking appropriatespacing.

This approval shall expire one year from the above dateunless substantial and continuous operation is underway, or arequest for extension is made prior to the expiration date. TheAPI identification number assigned to this well is 43-043-30143.

ohn R. Baza
Associate Director

lwp
Enclosures '
cc: Summit County Assessor

Bureau of Land Management, State



Operator: Amoco Production Company

Well Name & Number: Ch 372 "C" 1 ST #1
API Number: 43-043-30143

Lease: Fee

Location: NW NW Sec. 23 T. 4 N. R. 7 E.

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et
seq., the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules, and the
applicable terms and provisions of the approved Application
for Permit to Drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours following spudding the
well or commencing drilling operations. Contact Jim
Thompson at (801)538-5336.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug
and abandon the well. Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338
or John R. Baza at (801)538-5334.

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals shall be promptly
filed with the Division, including but not limited to the
Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water Encountered
During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for
drilling and completion operations, and Sundry Notices and
Reports on Wells requesting approval of change of plans or
other operational actions.

4. Compliance with the Conditions of Approval/Application for
Permit to Drill outlined in the Statement of Basis dated
March 20, 1998 (copy attached).

5. Cement volume for the 4½" production string shall be
determined from actual hole diameter in order to place
cement from the pipe setting depth back to 5650' MD as
indicated in the submitted drilling
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DV.OFOIL,GAS&MININ "l'g°jorado80201-0800

March 26, 1998

Mr. Lowell Braxton, Deputy Director/Acting Director
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P. O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

File: CAW-l l6-986.511

Application for an Exception to the Well Location
Requirements of the Anschutz Ranch Field Spacing Order
Champlin 372 Amoco C 1-ST No. 1
Section 23-T4N-R7E
Anschutz Ranch Field
Summit County, Utah

Amoco Production Company hereby makes application for administrative approval of an
exception to the well location requirements of the Anschutz Ranch Field spacing order.
Enclosed are written consents from all owners of direct and diagonally offsetting drilling
units. We respectively request, in the absence of any objection by the Division, that this
application be granted immediately and that the pending Application for Permit to Drill
also be approved.

The exception is required for the drilling of the Champlin 372 Amoco C 1-ST No. 1, a
proposed horizontal well to be drilled from a surfàce location in the NWl4 of Section 23-
T4N-R7E to a BHL in the SE/4 of Section 23-T4N-R7E.

Section 23-T4N-R7E is currently spaced on standup 320 acres for both the Nugget and
Twin Creek Formations. Permitted well locations are 990 feet from the boundaries of the
Northwest and Southeast quarters. Lands immediately to the North and East of Section
23-T4N-R7E are not spaced and are governed by the General Rules. Ownership
throughout Section 23 is common.

Amoco proposes to drill the Champlin 372 Amoco C 1-STNo. 1, as a Nugget test, from a
surface location 544 feet FWL and 866 feet FNL of Section 23-T4N-R7E, vertically to
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depth of approximately 4200 feet and then turn the well to the southeast towards a
location approximately 1770 feet FWL and 1890 feet FNL of Section 23-T4N-R7E at a
depth of approximately 6500 feet TVD. From this point the well will be drilled
horizontally to an end point of approximately 2775 feet FWL and 2650 feet FNL. At no
point in the projected pay would the well be closer than 990 feet from the exterior
boundary of the section.

Dependent upon the results of this well, Amoco may file a subsequent application to
modify the current Nugget spacing to accommodate this horizontal well. In as much as
the required written consents from offset owners have been furnished and given the fact
that ownership throughout Section 23 is common respectfully request that this application
be granted.

Attached and made part of this application is the required plat showing the legal location,
the proposed surface and bottomhole location, the location of all current wells and the
ownership within each section.

If you have any question or require additional information please contact myself at (303)
830-4327. Your prompt consideration of this request is appreciated.

Very y

C. A. Wood
Enclosures

cc:

Union Pacific Resources
P. O. Box 7
Fort Worth, TX 76101-0007
Attn: Charles Farmer

Anschutz Corporation
555 17th Street, Suite 2400
Denver, CO 80202
Attn: William Miller

B. S. McKim
R. B. Wilson
D.
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CONSENT
CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1-ST NO. 1

The undersigned, as an offsett owner to the proposed Champlin 372 Amoco C 1-ST No.1,
hereby grants consent to the drilling of the Champlin 372 Amoco C 1-ST No. 1 as an
exception to the well location requirements of the Anschutz Ranch Field spacing order.
It is our understanding that this well will be drilled as a horizontal well from a surface
location 544 feet FWL and 866 feet FNL of Section 23-T4N-R7E to an approximate
bottomhole location of 2775 feet FWL and 2650 feet FNL of Section 23-T4N-R7E,
Summit County, Utah. Furthermore, it is also our understanding that no point within the
projected pay zone will be closer than 990 feet from the exterior boundaries of Section
23-T4N-R7E.

Signed by:

Representing: (fNtoN P eig Ñgso<ac4; ÛoA/PA#y

Date: ÑAAcil / 9, /F
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CONSENT
CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1-ST NO. 1

The undersigned, as an offsett owner to the proposed Champlin 372 Amoco C 1-ST No.1,
hereby grants consent to the drilling of the Champlin 372 Amoco C 1-ST No. 1 as an
exception to the well location requirements of the Anschutz Ranch Field spacing order.
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Signed by: A Ë¾aedi
Representing: / gapi AD/.42DA

Date: /Ñ,
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DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: AMOCO FRODUCTION

Well Name: CH 372 "C" 1 ST 1 (RE-ENTRY)

Api No. 43-043-30143

Section 23 Township 4N Range 7E County SIIMMIT

Drilling Contractor SST

Rig # 56

SPUDDED:

Date 4/10/96

Time

How ROT.ARY

Drilling will commence

Reported by GIGI

Telephone # 1-303-830-4781

Date: 4/27/96 Signed:

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: AMOCO FRODUCTION

Well Name: CH 372 "C" 1 ST 1 (RE-ENTRY)

Api No. 43-043-30143

Section 23 Township 4N Range 7E County SIIMMIT

Drilling Contractor SST

Rig # 56

SPUDDED:

Date 4/10/96

Time

How ROT.ARY

Drilling will commence

Reported by GIGI

Telephone # 1-303-830-4781

Date: 4/27/96 Signed:



Form 9 STITE OF UTAH 5. Lease Designation and Serial
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING Number: FEE

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existingwells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells 7. Unit Agreement Name:Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for such proposals

8. Well Name and Number:
1. Type of Well: OIL GAS OTHER Ch 372 Amoco "C" 1

9. API Well Numberimamepro uition Company 43-043-30143
3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

P. O. Box 800, Denver CO 80201, Suite 812B 303-830-4781 Anschutz Ranch
4. Location of Well
Footages: County:
860' FNL x 536' FWL Summit
QQ, Sec., T.,R.,M.: State:
NWI4 Sec. 23-T4N-R7E Utah
11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit in Duplicate) (SubmitOriginal Form Only)

Abandonment New Construction Abandonment* New Construction
Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing
Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans Shoot or Acidize
conversionto injection Shoot or Acidize Conversion to Injection Vent or Flare
Fracture Treat Vent or Flare Fracture Treat Water Shut-Off
Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off Other Progress Report
Other Date of work completion

Approximate date work will start Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form.

* Must be accompaniedby a cement verification report

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true
vertical depths for a1\markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

See Attached Progress Report.

Ifyou require additional information, please contact Gigi Martinez at (303) 830-4781.

13. Signature - - Title: Regulatory Agent Date:

(This space for State use only)

DECEllVE
MAY26 1998

(SeeInstructionsOnReverseSide> DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING

Form 9 STITE OF UTAH 5. Lease Designation and Serial
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING Number: FEE

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existingwells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells 7. Unit Agreement Name:Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for such proposals

8. Well Name and Number:
1. Type of Well: OIL GAS OTHER Ch 372 Amoco "C" 1

9. API Well Numberimamepro uition Company 43-043-30143
3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

P. O. Box 800, Denver CO 80201, Suite 812B 303-830-4781 Anschutz Ranch
4. Location of Well
Footages: County:
860' FNL x 536' FWL Summit
QQ, Sec., T.,R.,M.: State:
NWI4 Sec. 23-T4N-R7E Utah
11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit in Duplicate) (SubmitOriginal Form Only)

Abandonment New Construction Abandonment* New Construction
Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing
Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans Shoot or Acidize
conversionto injection Shoot or Acidize Conversion to Injection Vent or Flare
Fracture Treat Vent or Flare Fracture Treat Water Shut-Off
Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off Other Progress Report
Other Date of work completion

Approximate date work will start Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form.

* Must be accompaniedby a cement verification report

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true
vertical depths for a1\markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

See Attached Progress Report.

Ifyou require additional information, please contact Gigi Martinez at (303) 830-4781.

13. Signature - - Title: Regulatory Agent Date:

(This space for State use only)
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AMOCO PRODUCTION Page 1 of 5

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1
Common Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1 Spud Date:
Event Name: PLUG BACK Start: 02/06/98 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Activity Code Phase Description of Operations

02/06/98 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 RIGSER P WK_REP Crew travelto location - Service equipment.
07:00 - 07:30 0.50 MISC P WK_REP Hold safety meeting
07:30 -09:00 1.50 MOVEIN P WK_REP Move in service unit & support equipment.
09:00 - 18:00 9.00 RI P WK_REP Rig up service rig & support equipment Move in tank & fillw/2% KCL

water.
18:00 - 19:00 1.00 SHUTIN P WK_REP Secure well. Crew travel

02/07/98 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 RIGSER P WK_REP Crew travelto location - Start & service equipment.
07:00 - 07:30 0.50 MISC P WK_REP Holdsafety meeting.
07:30 - 08:30 1.00 RI P WK_REP Finish rigging up support equipment. Rig up pumplines & test pumplines

to 3500 psi "good".
08:30 - 10:30 2.00 WELLKI P WK_REP Killwell. Pump 69 Bbis of 2% dwn casing, Pump 61 Bbis of 2% dwn 2 7/8"

into casing, Pump 60 Bbis of 2% dwn 2 3/8" tbg. No pressure build on
casing. Possible hole in 2 7/8" tbg.Stump test BOPE while killing well

10:30 - 11:00 0.50 NDWLHOP WK_REP Install BPV in both sides of hanger. Nipple dwn tree. Inspect liftthreads.
Threads ok

11:00 - 11:30 0.50 NUBOP P WK_REP Nipple up BOPE. Pull BPV out of short string
11:30 - 13:00 1.50 RIGMOD P WK_REP Rig up working floor & handling equipment for tubing.
13:00 - 15:30 2.50 EQREP X WK_REP Hanger landing pins corroded & taking cheaters & pipe wrenchs to back

out.
15:30 - 16:30 1.00 LAYDN X WK_REP Pull 2 7/8" side of hanger. Btm ring broke & laying on top of other part of

hanger in bowl. Open blind ram door & retreave broken pieces of hanger.
Snap latch came free only after pumping down 2 7/8" tbgat 2 BPM. Lay
down 2 7/8" hanger half.

16:30 - 17:00 0.50 TOH P WK_REP Strip tongs& wiping rubber on 2 7/8" tbg.POOH w/7 jts of 2 7/8" 6.5# CS
hydril. Lay dwn 8', two6' & 4' space out pups.

17:00 - 18:00 1.00 SHUTIN P WK_REP Double back drill line. Drain up pumplines & pump.

Shut in & secure well for night.

NOTE: Tree being sent to cameron shop. After completion is same tree
to be used or is tree being changed to single string tree or staying wldual
string tree.

18:00 - 19:00 1.00 WK_REP Crew travel.
02/08/98 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 RIGSER P WK_REP Crew travel to location - Start & service equipment.

07:00 - 07:30 0.50 MISC P WK_REP Hold safety meeting.
07:30 -08:30 1.00 WELLKI P WK_REP Slight blow on 2 7/8" tbg - Slight blow on casing - Rig up pump &

pumplines - Pump 80 Bbis of filtered 2% KCL water dwn tbg & killwell.
08:30 - 09:45 1.25 TOH P WK_REP POOH w/186 jts of 2 7/8" 6.5# CS hydril tbg standing back in derrick.

Total of 193 jts of 2 7/8" 6.5# CS Hydril tbg.
09:45 - 10:00 0.25 LAYDN P WK_REP Lay down snap latch & 8' Tbg pup above snap latch.
10:00 - 10:45 0.75 RIGMOD P WK_REP Single back drill line - Change out tbg handling equipment from 2 7/8" to 2

3/8" - Change pipe rams to 2 3/8" center bores.
10:45 - 11:00 0.25 SPECEC P WK_REP Pull back pressure valve & install lifting pup into hanger on 2 3/8" side
11:00 - 12:00 1.00 SPECEC P WK_REP Pull on 2 3/8" tbg to release A-5 packer - Pull up to 80,000#'s with no

movement - Pulling 45,000#'s over calculated dry string weight - Hook up
kelly hose to tbg & pump 4 BPM while working tbg - Unable to work
packer free - Set hanger back into bowl.

12:00 - 13:15 1.25 NDBOP X WK_REP Nipple down annular BOP to obtain enough space to pull hanger & hanger
sleeve out of hole - Pull hanger & sleeve out of hole & lay down.

13:15 - 14:30 1.25 WKPIPE X WK_REP Install tbg pup on long string - Work tbgto attempt to release A-5 packer -

Pulling up to 80,000#'s & slacking all of pipe weight down on packer -

Unable to release packer - Pull tbgweight up to 80,000#'s & set slips &
shut pipe rams.
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02/06/98 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 RIGSER P WK_REP Crew travelto location - Service equipment.
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down 2 7/8" hanger half.
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movement - Pulling 45,000#'s over calculated dry string weight - Hook up
kelly hose to tbg & pump 4 BPM while working tbg - Unable to work
packer free - Set hanger back into bowl.

12:00 - 13:15 1.25 NDBOP X WK_REP Nipple down annular BOP to obtain enough space to pull hanger & hanger
sleeve out of hole - Pull hanger & sleeve out of hole & lay down.

13:15 - 14:30 1.25 WKPIPE X WK_REP Install tbg pup on long string - Work tbgto attempt to release A-5 packer -

Pulling up to 80,000#'s & slacking all of pipe weight down on packer -
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1
Common Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1 Spud Date:
Event Name: PLUGBACK Start: 02/06/98 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Activity Code Phase Description of Operations

02/08/98 14:30 - 15:30 1.00 SHUTIN P WK_REP Shut in & secure well for night - Drain up pump & pumplines.
15:30 - 16:30 1.00 WK_REP Crew travel.

Prep to rig up wireline in AM

NOTE:
Wellhead tbgspool needs to be changed out or takenin due to

being in bad condition &will need to be machined if completed w/single
tbg hanger after drilling is done. Bowl size now is 6 5/16" bore going by
stamp on tbg head. Present head will also need new tiedown pins &
packing glands.

02/09/98 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 RIGSER P WK_REP Crew travel to location - Start & service equipment
07:00 - 07:30 0.50 MISC P WK_REP Hold safety meeting
07:30 - 08:30 1.00 MVIN P WK_REP Move in & rig up OWP wireline
08:30 - 13:15 4.75 ELECLI P WK_REP RIH w/ rattle shot & spot rattle shot in A-5 packer w/35,000#'s pulled over

on long string - Shoot rattle shot w/no movement indicated after shot -

ROH w/wireline - RIH wltubing punch gun & perforate below packer 5.44'
at 6103.57' (topshot) - Shot 4 holes at 4 spf - ROH w/gun (all shots fired)
- RIH chemical cutter & cut tbgoff at 6071' leaving 21.81' of tbg above
packer - ROH w/wireline.

13:15 - 14:00 0.75 MVOUT P WK_REP Rig down wireline & move off location.
14:00 - 16:45 2.75 TOH P WK_REP POOH w/5 tbgpups, 206 jts of 2 3/8" 4.7# CS hydril tbg& 5.5' cut offstub

laying down & tallying. 6056.29' totalpipe layed down.
16:45 - 17:30 0.75 NUBOP P WK_REP Nipple up annular BOP & prep tbg handling equipment to run 2 7/8" tbg.
17:30 - 18:30 1.00 SHUTIN P WK_REP Shut in & secure well for night. Move tbgoff racks in preperation to haul

off location.
18:30 - 19:30 1.00 WK_REP Crew travel in.

NOTE:
Verbal approval given by John Boza wlUtah state to set cmt

retainer above A-5 packer & squeeze off lower perfs for plugback in
preperation of sidetrack. Approval given at 13:30 hr on Feb 9, 1998 via
cellular phone to J. Vern Griffin.

John's onlyconcern was the isolation from each other of the Twin
Creek & Nugget formations.

02/10/98 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 RIGSER P WK_REP Crew travelto location - Start & service equipment
07:00 - 07:30 0.50 MISC P WK_REP Hold safety meeting
07:30 - 08:30 1.00 SPECEC P WK_REP Pick up & make up HES "HCS"cement retainer on tbg. Warm up tongsto

set torque accuratly.
08:30 - 13:00 4.50 TIH P WK_REP TlH w/2 7/8" 6.5# N-80 CS Hydril tbg & HES model "HCS" cement retainer

- Tag top of cut off stub at 6071' - POOH wltbg putting btm of retainer at
6054.11' KB & topof retainer at 6051.98' KB

13:00 - 13:30 0.50 SETPLG P WK_REP Set retainer - Top of retainer at 6051.98' - Shear out of retainer - Sting
back into retainer w/stinger to pressure test.

13:30 - 16:30 3.00 PRSRTS P WK_REP Pressure test retainer via annulus to 1580 psi for 15 min "GOOD" -

Pressure test tbgto 2000 psi for 15 min "GOOD" - Attempt to establish
injection rate thru retainer - Unable to get injection rate due to pressuring
up on tbg - Possible blockage in retainer or stinger - Max pressure
attempted to blow thru retainer is 4000 psi - Attempt to surge any debris
out of retainer by pressuring up on tbg & stinging out retainer. Circulate
conventional & attempt towash out retainer bore - Unable to clear debris -
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Legal Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1
Common Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1 Spud Date:
Event Name: PLUGBACK Start: 02/06/98 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Activity Code Phase Description of Operations

02/10/98 13:30 - 16:30 3.00 PRSRTS P WK_REP Seals on stinger wore out & not holding. Prep to POOH.
16:30 - 18:00 1.50 TOH P WK_REP POOH Wl2.875" tbg &stinger - Stinger was not scope out all the way -

18:00 - 19:00 1.00 SHUTIN P WK_REP Shut in &secure well for night. Drain up pump & pumplines.
19:00 - 20:00 1.00 WK_REP Crew travel

02/11/98 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 RIGSER P WK_REP Crew travelto location - Start & service equipment
07:00 -07:30 0.50 MISC P WK_REP Hold safety meeting
07:30 - 10:00 2.50 TIH P WK_REP TIH w/stinger & 2.875" CS Hydril tbg - Sting into retainer - Tbg went on

vaccum.
10:00 - 10:30 0.50 PRSRTS P WK_REP Establish injection rate down tbg thru retainer into formation - Pumping 5

BPM at 500 psi
10:30 - 11:00 0.50 SHUTIN P WK_REP Shut in & secure well for night - Drain up pump & pumpline.
11:00 - 12:00 1.00 WK_REP Crew travelhome

02/12/98 06:00 - 07:00 RIGSER P WK_REP Rig crew travelto location - Start &service rig equipment
07:00 - 10:00 3.00 MVIN P WK_REP Move in Dowell cementers - Road bad & icy - Wait on grader & sand truck

to clean road - Road was cleaned earlier but trucks spun out on hill. Pull
trucksup hill w/grader.

10:00 - 11:00 1.00 CMTSQLP WK_REP Rig up Dowell cementers &test pump lines to 3500 psi "GOOD"
11:00 - 14:00 3.00 CMTSQ2'P WK_REP Pump 10 Bbis of fresh water spacer - Pump 80 Bbis of 15.8 ppg class G

cement - Pump 10 Bbis of fresh water displacement at .35 bpm - Shut
pump dwn for 1/2 hr for hesitation - Pump 15 Bbis of fresh water
dispacement at .66 bpm - Shut pump dwn for 1/2 hr for hesitation - Pump
15 Bbis of fresh water displacement at .66 bpm & clear retainer by 5 Bbis

- Sting out of retainer - Reverse out w/60 Bbis of fresh water - Returned 1
to 2 Bbis of dirty water w/ no cement, 5 bbis pumped on reverse out
before catching returns - CALCULATED CEMENT LEVEL IN HOLE AT
6384' AFTER STINGING OUT. Rig dwn pumplines.

14:00 - 14:30 0.50 TOH P WK_REP POOH w/5 jts of tbg - Drain up rig pump & pumplines.
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 SHUTIN P WK_REP Shut in & secure well for night.
15:00 - 16:00 1.00 WK_REP Crew travelin

02/13/98 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 RIGSER P WK_REP Crew travelto location - Start &service equipment.
07:00 - 07:30 0.50 MISC P WK_REP Hold safety meeting
07:30 -07:45 0.25 TIH P WK_REP TIH w/5 jts of 2.875" tbg& sting into retainer - Tubing went on vaccum.
07:45 - 08:00 0.25 PRSRTS P WK_REP Rig up pumplines from rig pump - Pump thru retainer at 4 BPM w/no to

very little pump pressure. Sting out of retainer &wait on cementers.
08:00 - 10:00 2.00 WAITIN X WK_REP Dowell cement bulk truckstuck on hill due to icy roads - Grader maintainer

pull in bulck truck to location.
10:00 - 10:30 0.50 CMTSQ2P WK_REP Rig up Dowell pump & pumplines.
10:30 - 12:45 2.25 CMTSQ2P WK REP Pump 5 Bbis fresh water spacer, Pump 30 Bbis of 15.8 ppg cement, Sting

into retainer, Pump 29 Bbis of 15.8 ppg cement, Pump 5 Bbl fresh water
displacement, Hesitate for 15 min, Pump 5 Bbl fresh water displacement,
Hesitate for 15 min, Pump 5 Bbl fresh water displacement, Hesitate for 15
min, Pump 5 bbi fresh water displacement, Hesitate 15 min, Pump 5 Bbl
fresh water displacement, Pump 15 Bbl fresh water displacement & clear
retainer by 5 Bbis - Sting out of retainer & reverse out - No cement water
circulated out on reverse.

12:45 - 15:00 2.25 WAITIN X WK_REP Waiting on more cement - Dowell called & bulk truck broke dwn in transit
to location.

15:00 - 15:30 0.50 TOH P WK_REP POOH w/5 jts of tbgto lower fluid level to keep from fluid freezing in
BOPE & tubingabove ground.

15:30 - 16:00 0.50 SHUTIN P WK_REP Shut in secure well for night - Drain up pump & pumplines.
16:00 - 17:00 1.00 WK_REP Crew travel home.

02/14/98 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 RIGSER P WK_REP Crew travelto location - Start &service equipment
07:00 - 07:30 0.50 MISC P WK_REP Hold safety meeting
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Rig Name: Rig Number:
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02/14/98 07:30 - 08:45 1.25 TIH P WK_.REP TIH w/5 jts of tbg & sting into retainer - Rig up pumplines - Test pumplines
to 3500 psi "good"- Obtain injection rate thru retainer at 500 psi 2 BPM -

Sting out of retainer to spot cement.
08:45 - 09:30 0.75 CMTSQL P WK_REP Pump 5 Bbl fresh water spacer

Pump 12 Bbis of 16# RFC cement
Pump 13 Bbis of fresh displacement water
Sting into retainer
Pump 20 1/2 Bbis of fresh displacement water obtaining 1150 psi squeeze
at 1/4 BPM (10 Bbis of cmt thru retainer)
Sting out of retainer & reverse out returning 2 Bbis of cmt to pit
POOH 60' towait on cmt.

09:30 - 11:00 1.50 WOC P WK_REP Wait on cement to set
11:00 - 12:00 1.00 CMTPLG P WK_REP TIH w/60' to topof retainer (no cmt tag)

Reverse out w/40 Bbis of water, recovering no cmt - Mix & pump 3 Bbls of
cmt & spot to balance w/32 Bbis of water - Pick up 30' & reverse out
recovering 1 Bbl of cmt to pit - 2 Bbis of cmt on retainer - Calculated cmt
topat 6022' (30' cmt cap on retainer)

12:00 - 13:45 1.75 TOH P WK_REP POOH w/2.875" tbg& stinger - Lay down stinger
13:45 - 14:30 0.75 CHANGE P WK_REP Make up 6" Bit & Scraper for 7" casing
14:30 - 16:00 1.50 TIH P WK_REP TIH w/bit & scraper to 6020'
16:00 - 16:45 0.75 CIRC P WK_REP Reverse circulate hole clean w/60 Bbis of water - Returns cleaned up after

40 Bbis - Rusty colored water.
16:45 - 17:30 0.75 TOH P WK_REP POOH w/72 jts of tbg - Standing tbgback in derrick
17:30 - 18:30 1.00 SHUTIN P WK_REP Shut in & secure well for night - Drain up pump & pumplines.
18:30 - 19:30 1.00 WK_REP Crew travelhome

02/15/98 06:00 -07:00 1.00 RIGSER P WK_REP Crew travelto location - Start & service equipment.
07:00 -07:30 0.50 MISC P WK_REP Hold safety meeting
07:30 -08:30 1.00 TOH P WK_REP POOH w/2.875" tbg& lay dwn Bit & Scraper.
08:30 -09:30 0.55 MVIN P WK_REP Move in & rig up Schlumberger wireline
09:30 - 18:00 8.50 ELECLI P WK_REP RIH w/CBLUSIT logging toolsto 6010' - Log up from 6010' thru3600'

finding cement topat 4919'+ - with 1000 psi held on casing, also
obtainingcasing data ( wt. & conditionof csg ) - Logging toolsquit working
while logging at 3586' - Bond log logged with 1000 psi on casing.
ROH wltools & inspect tools- Pull CCL out of toolstring - RIH wllogging
tools without CCL to 3800' and attempt to obtain casing inspection log -

Tool quits working again - Pull tools up to 1000' & re-start - Log down from
1000' to 4000' w/USIT for casing inspection log - Obtain inspection log.
ROH wllogging tools

18:00 - 18:30 0.50 ELECLI P WK_REP Rig down wireline
18:30 - 19:00 0.50 SHUTIN P WK_REP Shut in & secure well for night.
19:00 - 20:00 1.00 WK_REP Crew travelin.

02/16/98 06:00 - 08:00 2.00 RIGSER P WK_REP Travel to location - Start & service rig - Partial crew on location - Other
crew members late due to bad roads - Pressure test 7" casing to 1700 psi
for 30 minutes "good"

08:00 - 08:30 0.50 MISC P WK_REP Hold safety meeting
08:30 -09:00 0.50 TRIP P WK_REP Pick up & make up HES model "3-L" retrievable bridge plug - TIH w/RBP

& 33 jts of 2.875" tbg & set plug at 1032'.
09:00 -09:15 0.25 TOH P WK_REP POOH wltbg & setting tool
09:15 -09:30 0.25 NDBOP P WK_REP Nipple down BOPE off wellhead.
09:30 - 12:45 3.25 NDWLHDP WK_REP Nipple down old tbg spool & nipple up new tbgspool - Pressure test new

tbgspool to 2500 psi "good"
12:45 - 13:15 0.50 NUBOP P WK_REP Nipple up BOPE on topof new tbgspool.
13:15 - 13:45 0.50 TIH P WK_REP TIH & release bridge plug
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1
Common Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1 Spud Date:
Event Name: PLUG BACK Start: 02/06/98 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Activity Code Phase Description of Operations i

02/16/98 13:45 - 14:30 0.75 TOH P WK_REP POOH wltbg & bridge plug - Lay down bridge plug.
14:30 - 16:15 1.75 TIH P WK_REP Pick up & make up 2' perforate pup w/bull plug in bottom - TIH w/pup &

2.875" tbg - Tag cement topat 6018.22' KB ( tbgtallymeasure)
16:15 - 16:30 0.25 TOH P WK_REP TOH w/4 jts of tbg to lower fluid level - Prep to displace casing fluid

w/corrosion inhibited fluid in AM.
16:30 - 17:30 1.00 SHUTIN P WK REP Shut in &secure well for night - Drain pump & pumplines.
17:30 - 18:30 1.00 WK REP Crew travelin.

02/17/98 06:00 -07:00 1.00 RIGSER P WK_REP Crew travel to loaction - Start & service equipment
07:00 -07:30 0.50 MISC P WK_REP Hold safety meeting.
07:30 - 07:45 0.25 TIH P WK_REP TIH w/4 jts of tbg.
07:45 -09:45 2.00 MIX P WK_REP Rig up pumplines & pump - Mix corrosion inhibited water.
09:45 - 11:30 1.75 CIRC P WK_REP Displace 7" casing volume w/corrosion inhibited 2% KCL water.
11:30 - 14:00 2.50 LAYDN P WK_REP POOH Iaying down 2.875" tbg & 2' perforated tbg pup
14:00 - 14:30 0.50 RIGMOD P WK_REP Rig dwn working floor & tbg handling equipment.
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 NDBOP P WK_REP Nipple down BOPE & load on truck
15:00 - 15:15 0.25 NUWLHOP WK_REP Nipple up tappedblind flange on wellhead.
15:15 - 18:00 2.75 RD P WK _REP Rig down service rig & support equipment - Load & move off 2.875" CS

hydril to Tubescope yard, Evanston, WY.
18:00 - 19:00 1.00 WK_REP Crew travelin.

Finish rigging dwn & movingoff location in AM
02/18/98 06:00 - 07:00 RIGSER P WK_REP Crew travel- Start & service equipment

07:00 - 16:00 9.00 MOVEOUP WK_REP Load out trucks & move out rig support equipment - Move rig off location -

Location ready for preperation for drillingrig.....
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Form 9 STATE OF UTAH 5. Lease Designation and Serial
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING Number: FEE

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existingwells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells 7. Unit Agreement Name:
Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for such proposals

8. Well Name and Number:
1. Type of Well: OIL GAS OTHER ,,Ch 372 Amoco "C 1

9. API Well Numberimam e ouStiOn
COmpany 43-043-30143

3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

P. O. Box 800, Denver CO 80201, Suite 812B 303-830-4781 Anschutz Ranch
4. Location of Well
Footages: County:
860' FNL x 536' FWL Summit
QQ, Sec., T.,R.,M.: State:
NWI4 Sec. 23-T4N-R7E Utah

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

O Abandonment New Construction Abandonment* New Construction
Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing
Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans Shoot or Acidize
Conversion to Injection Shoot or Acidize Conversion to Injection Vent or Flare
Fracture Treat Vent or Flare Fracture Treat Water Shut-Off
Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off Other Progress Report
Other Date of work completion

Approximate date work will start Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETlON AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true
vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

See Attached Progress Report.

If you require additional information, please contact Gigi Martinez at (303) 830-4781.

DW.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

13. Signatur -
- (/1 Title: Regulatory Agent Date:

(This space for State use only)

(See Instructions On Reverse
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1
Common Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1 Spud Date:
Event Name: REN Start: 04/08/98 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Activity Code Phase Description of Operations

04/11/98 18:00 - 18:00 24.00 RURIG P SDTRK1 START MOVE IN ON 04/07/98
FINISH MOVE IN ON 04/10/98
START RIG UP ON 04/08/98
FINISH RIG UP ON 04/11/98
START RIG UP OF TOP DRIVE 04/10/98
PRESENT OPERATION RIG UP TOP DRIVE, RIG UP AND TEST BOP
STACK
TEST BLIND RAMS, PIPE RAMS, CHOKE MANIFOLD, KELLYVALVES,
FLOOR VALVES, KILLAND CHOKE LINESTO 250 PSI LOW AND 5000
PSI HIGH, TEST ANNULAR TO 250 PSI LOW AND 2500 PSI HIGH, ALL
TEST GOOD

04/12/98 18:00 - 20:00 2.00 TSTBOP P SDTRK1 PRESS. TEST BOP EQUIPMENT
TEST RAMS, VALVES AND CHOKE TO 250 PSI LOW AND 5000 PSI
HIGH
TEST ANNULAR TO 250 PSI LOW AND 2500 PSI HIGH, TEST GOOD

20:00 - 22:00 2.00 MISC P SDTRK1 RIG UP GAS BUSTER
22:00 -05:00 7.00 RIGMOD P SDTRK1 FINISH RIGGING UP TOP DRIVE UNIT
05:00 -17:00 12.00 TUBMOUP SDTRK1 PICK UP 3.5" DRILL PIPE AND TRIP IN HOLE W/BIT AND CASING

SCRAPER,
TAG UP AT 6020'

17:00 - 17:15 0.25 TSTCSG P SDTRK1 PRESS. TEST CASING TO 1500 PSI
17:15 - 18:00 0.75 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT OF HOLE

04/13/98 18:00 - 22:00 4.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT WITH CASING SCRAPER
22:00 -00:00 2.00 MISC P SDTRK1 RIG UP SCHLUMBERGER, RUN IN HOLE WITH WHIPSTOCK PACKER

SET AT 5624' BASED ON CBL LOG
00:00 -06:00 6.00 SUR P SDTRK1 RIG UP SCIENTIFIC AND RUN GYRO SURVEYS FROM 5624' UP TO

SURF.
06:00 -07:00 1.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 PICK UP & ORIENT WHIPSTOCK
07:00 - 10:30 3.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE WITH WHIPSTOCK

SET WHIPSTOCK ON PACKER AT 5624'
10:30 - 12:00 1.50 CIRC P SDTRK1 LOAD HOLE WITH LIGHT MUD

DISPLACE OUT KCL WATER TO PIT
12:00 - 14:00 2.00 MILL P SDTRK1 START CUTTING WINDOW WITH STARTING MILL(CUT 2')
14:00 - 14:30 0.50 CIRC P SDTRKi CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP
14:30 - 18:00 3.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT WITH STARTINGMILL

04/14/98 18:00 - 19:00 1.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 PICK UP WINDOW MILLAND STRING MILLTO CUT WINDOW
19:00 - 20:30 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE
20:30 -07:30 11.00 MILL P SDTRK1 MILLWINDOW FROM 5614' TO 5624'

DRILL4' PAST WINDOW TO 5628'
07:30 -08:15 0.75 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP
08:15 - 10:30 2.25 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT WITH WINDOW MILLS
10:30 - 11:30 1.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 PICK UP BIT AND STRING MILL
11:30 - 13:00 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE WITH BIT AND STRING MILLTO SMOOTH OUT

WINDOW
13:00 - 14:00 1.00 MILL P SDTRK1 WORK MILLTHROUGH WINDOW TO SMOOTH OUT OPENING
14:00 - 17:15 3.25 DRL P SDTRK1 DRILLTO 5650' , SHOULD BE ENOUGH OPEN HOLE FOR THE MUD

MOTOR
17:15 - 18:00 0.75 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP

04/15/98 18:00 - 18:30 0.50 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP
18:30 - 21:00 2.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT FOR DIRECTIONAL TOOLS
21:00 - 23:00 2.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 PICK UP DIRECTIONAL TOOLS

23:00 - 23:45 0.75 RIGSER P SDTRK1 T
TMMUUDDMMOORRMWSDERANDCEMRONGELS
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20:30 -07:30 11.00 MILL P SDTRK1 MILLWINDOW FROM 5614' TO 5624'

DRILL4' PAST WINDOW TO 5628'
07:30 -08:15 0.75 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP
08:15 - 10:30 2.25 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT WITH WINDOW MILLS
10:30 - 11:30 1.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 PICK UP BIT AND STRING MILL
11:30 - 13:00 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE WITH BIT AND STRING MILLTO SMOOTH OUT

WINDOW
13:00 - 14:00 1.00 MILL P SDTRK1 WORK MILLTHROUGH WINDOW TO SMOOTH OUT OPENING
14:00 - 17:15 3.25 DRL P SDTRK1 DRILLTO 5650' , SHOULD BE ENOUGH OPEN HOLE FOR THE MUD

MOTOR
17:15 - 18:00 0.75 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP

04/15/98 18:00 - 18:30 0.50 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP
18:30 - 21:00 2.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT FOR DIRECTIONAL TOOLS
21:00 - 23:00 2.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 PICK UP DIRECTIONAL TOOLS

23:00 - 23:45 0.75 RIGSER P SDTRK1 T
TMMUUDDMMOORRMWSDERANDCEMRONGELS
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Legal Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1
Common Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1 Spud Date:
Event Name: REN Start: 04/08/98 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Activity Code Phase Description of Operations

04/15/98 23:45 - 03:00 3.25 TUBMOUP SDTRK1 PICK UP 54 JOINTS HEAVY WT. DP
03:00 -05:30 2.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE WITH DIRECTIONAL TOOLS, TEST MWD
05:30 -06:00 0.50 REAM P SDTRK1 WORK THROUGH WINDOW SLOWLY

NO PROBLEMS
06:00 -09:30 3.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 SLIDE FROM 5650' TO 5664'

ROTATE FROM 5664' TO 5682'
09:30 -09:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5634', 23.2 DEG, 126.5 AZ
09:45 - 13:30 3.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 5682' TO 5700'

SLIDE FROM 5700' TO 5713'
13:30 - 13:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5665', 25 DEG, 126 AZ
13:45 - 16:45 3.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 5713' TO 5729'

SLIDE FROM 5729' TO 5744'
16:45 - 17:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5696', 25.1 DEG, 127.7 AZ
17:00 - 18:00 1.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 5744' TO 5759'

SLIDE FROM 5759' TO 5760'
04/16/98 18:00 - 19:15 1.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 SLIDE FRIM 5760' TO 5775'

19:15 - 19:30 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5727', 27.2 DEG, 130 AZ
19:30 - 22:30 3.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 5775' TO 5790'

SLIDE FROM 5790' TO 5806'
22:30 - 22:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5758', 28.1 DEG, 123.7 AZ
22:45 - 00:30 1.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 5806' TO 5822'

SLIDE FROM 5822' TO 5838'
00:30 - 00:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5790', 28.2 DEG, 124.2 AZ
00:45 - 03:15 2.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 5838' TO 5850'

SLIDE FROM 5850' TO 5870'
03:15 -03:30 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5822', 28.9 DEG, 122.7 AZ
03:30 - 06:00 2.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 5870' TO 5875'

SLIDE FROM 5875' TO 5901'
06:00 - 06:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5853', 29.9 DEG, 121.3 AZ
06:15 - 09:45 3.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 5901' TO 591T

SLIDE FROM 5917' TO 5933'
09:45 - 10:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5885', 32.4 DEG, 122.6 AZ
10:00 - 13:30 3.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 5933' TO 5950'

SLIDE FROM 5950' TO 5968'
13:30 - 13:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5916', 33.7 DEG, 123.4 AZ
13:45 - 17:00 3.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 5968' TO 5980'

SLIDE FROM 5980' TO 6001'
17:00 - 17:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5948', 34.9 DEG, 124.9 AZ
17:15 - 18:00 0.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6001' TO 6016'

04/17/98 18:00 - 20:00 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 SLIDE FROM 6016' TO 6027'
20:00 - 20:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5979', 36 DEG, 125.5 AZ
20:15 - 23:00 2.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6027' TO 6036'

SLIDE FROM 6036' TO 6059'
23:00 - 23:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6011', 37.5 DEG, 126.5 AZ
23:15 - 01:30 2.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6059' TO 6070'

SLIDE FROM 6070' TO 6091'
01:30 - 01:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6042', 39 DEG, 125.5 AZ
01:45 - 03:45 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6091' TO 609T

SLIDE FROM 6097' TO 6122'
03:45 - 04:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6074', 40.9 DEG, 123.4 AZ
04:00 - 07:00 3.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6122' TO 6132'

SLIDE FROM 6132' TO 6153'
07:00 -07:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6105', 42.4 DEG, 120.6 AZ
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04/15/98 23:45 - 03:00 3.25 TUBMOUP SDTRK1 PICK UP 54 JOINTS HEAVY WT. DP
03:00 -05:30 2.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE WITH DIRECTIONAL TOOLS, TEST MWD
05:30 -06:00 0.50 REAM P SDTRK1 WORK THROUGH WINDOW SLOWLY

NO PROBLEMS
06:00 -09:30 3.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 SLIDE FROM 5650' TO 5664'

ROTATE FROM 5664' TO 5682'
09:30 -09:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5634', 23.2 DEG, 126.5 AZ
09:45 - 13:30 3.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 5682' TO 5700'

SLIDE FROM 5700' TO 5713'
13:30 - 13:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5665', 25 DEG, 126 AZ
13:45 - 16:45 3.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 5713' TO 5729'

SLIDE FROM 5729' TO 5744'
16:45 - 17:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5696', 25.1 DEG, 127.7 AZ
17:00 - 18:00 1.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 5744' TO 5759'

SLIDE FROM 5759' TO 5760'
04/16/98 18:00 - 19:15 1.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 SLIDE FRIM 5760' TO 5775'

19:15 - 19:30 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5727', 27.2 DEG, 130 AZ
19:30 - 22:30 3.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 5775' TO 5790'

SLIDE FROM 5790' TO 5806'
22:30 - 22:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5758', 28.1 DEG, 123.7 AZ
22:45 - 00:30 1.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 5806' TO 5822'

SLIDE FROM 5822' TO 5838'
00:30 - 00:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5790', 28.2 DEG, 124.2 AZ
00:45 - 03:15 2.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 5838' TO 5850'

SLIDE FROM 5850' TO 5870'
03:15 -03:30 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5822', 28.9 DEG, 122.7 AZ
03:30 - 06:00 2.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 5870' TO 5875'

SLIDE FROM 5875' TO 5901'
06:00 - 06:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5853', 29.9 DEG, 121.3 AZ
06:15 - 09:45 3.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 5901' TO 591T

SLIDE FROM 5917' TO 5933'
09:45 - 10:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5885', 32.4 DEG, 122.6 AZ
10:00 - 13:30 3.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 5933' TO 5950'

SLIDE FROM 5950' TO 5968'
13:30 - 13:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5916', 33.7 DEG, 123.4 AZ
13:45 - 17:00 3.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 5968' TO 5980'

SLIDE FROM 5980' TO 6001'
17:00 - 17:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5948', 34.9 DEG, 124.9 AZ
17:15 - 18:00 0.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6001' TO 6016'

04/17/98 18:00 - 20:00 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 SLIDE FROM 6016' TO 6027'
20:00 - 20:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 5979', 36 DEG, 125.5 AZ
20:15 - 23:00 2.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6027' TO 6036'

SLIDE FROM 6036' TO 6059'
23:00 - 23:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6011', 37.5 DEG, 126.5 AZ
23:15 - 01:30 2.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6059' TO 6070'

SLIDE FROM 6070' TO 6091'
01:30 - 01:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6042', 39 DEG, 125.5 AZ
01:45 - 03:45 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6091' TO 609T

SLIDE FROM 6097' TO 6122'
03:45 - 04:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6074', 40.9 DEG, 123.4 AZ
04:00 - 07:00 3.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6122' TO 6132'

SLIDE FROM 6132' TO 6153'
07:00 -07:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6105', 42.4 DEG, 120.6 AZ
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Legal Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1
Common Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1 Spud Date:
Event Name: REN Start: 04/08/98 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Activity Code Phase Description of Operations

04/17/98 07:15 - 08:30 1.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6153' TO 6158'
SLIDE FROM 6158' TO 6164'

08:30 - 09:00 0.50 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE
PREPARE FOR TRIP OUT

09:00 - 11:00 2.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT FOR BIT
11:00 - 13:00 2.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 CHANGE OUT BIT, TEST MWD
13:00 - 15:30 2.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE WINEW BIT
15:30 - 18:00 2.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 SLIDE FROM 6164' TO 6184'

04/18/98 18:00 - 18:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6136', 42.4 DEG, 120.6 AZ
18:15 - 19:30 1.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6184' TO 6196'

SLIDE FROM 6196' TO 6215'
19:30 - 19:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 616T, 44.9 DEG, 117.8 AZ
19:45 -00:30 4.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 SLIDE FROM 6215' TO 6227'

ROTATE FROM 6227' TO 6233'
SLIDE FROM 6233' TO 624T

00:30 -00:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6199', 46.6 DEG, 118.5 AZ
00:45 - 03:30 2.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 624T TO 6255'

SLIDE FROM 6255' TO 6279'
03:30 - 03:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6231', 49 DEG, 120.6 AZ
03:45 - 06:45 3.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6279' TO 628T

SLIDE FROM 628T TO 6311'
06:45 -07:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6263', 51.5 DEG, 120.6 AZ
07:00 - 11:30 4.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6311' TO 6316'

SLIDE FROM 6316' TO 6342'
11:30 - 11:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6294', 53.6 DEG, 120.6 AZ
11:45 - 16:15 4.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6342' TO 6355'

SLIDE FROM 6355' TO 6374'
16:15 - 16:30 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6326', 56.3 DEG, 120.6 AZ
16:30 - 18:00 1.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6374' TO 6392'

04/19/98 18:00 - 19:30 1.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6392' TO 6406'
19:30 - 19:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6358', 58.8 DEG, 120.6 AZ
19:45 - 22:30 2.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6406' TO 643T
22:30 - 22:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6389', 60.2 DEG, 120.6 AZ
22:45 - 00:00 1.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6437' TO 6468'
00:00 - 00:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6420', 59.1 DEG, 121.3 AZ
00:15 - 05:00 4.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6468' TO 6473'

SLIDE FROM 6473' TO 6499'
05:00 - 05:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6451', 57.5 DEG, 122 AZ
05:15 - 11:30 6.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6499' TO 6505'

SLIDE FROM 6505' TO 6530'
11:30 - 11:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6482', 58.3 DEG, 123.4 AZ
11:45 - 17:15 5.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6530' TO 6550'

SLIDE FROM 6550' TO 6557'
ROTATE FROM 6557' TO 6562'

17:15 - 17:30 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6514', 61.2 DEG, 123.8 AZ
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6562' TO 6568'

04/20/98 18:00 - 20:15 2.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6568' TO 6586'
SLIDE FROM 6586' TO 6594'

20:15 - 20:30 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6546', 63.1 DEG, 122.7 AZ
20:30 - 22:30 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6594' TO 6624'
22:30 - 22:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6577', 63.9 DEG, 123.7 AZ
22:45 - 01:30 2.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6624' TO 6655'
01:30 - 01:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6608', 64.4 DEG, 123.4 AZ
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18:15 - 19:30 1.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6184' TO 6196'
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00:30 -00:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6199', 46.6 DEG, 118.5 AZ
00:45 - 03:30 2.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 624T TO 6255'

SLIDE FROM 6255' TO 6279'
03:30 - 03:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6231', 49 DEG, 120.6 AZ
03:45 - 06:45 3.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6279' TO 628T

SLIDE FROM 628T TO 6311'
06:45 -07:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6263', 51.5 DEG, 120.6 AZ
07:00 - 11:30 4.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6311' TO 6316'

SLIDE FROM 6316' TO 6342'
11:30 - 11:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6294', 53.6 DEG, 120.6 AZ
11:45 - 16:15 4.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6342' TO 6355'

SLIDE FROM 6355' TO 6374'
16:15 - 16:30 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6326', 56.3 DEG, 120.6 AZ
16:30 - 18:00 1.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6374' TO 6392'

04/19/98 18:00 - 19:30 1.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6392' TO 6406'
19:30 - 19:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6358', 58.8 DEG, 120.6 AZ
19:45 - 22:30 2.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6406' TO 643T
22:30 - 22:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6389', 60.2 DEG, 120.6 AZ
22:45 - 00:00 1.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6437' TO 6468'
00:00 - 00:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6420', 59.1 DEG, 121.3 AZ
00:15 - 05:00 4.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6468' TO 6473'

SLIDE FROM 6473' TO 6499'
05:00 - 05:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6451', 57.5 DEG, 122 AZ
05:15 - 11:30 6.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6499' TO 6505'

SLIDE FROM 6505' TO 6530'
11:30 - 11:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6482', 58.3 DEG, 123.4 AZ
11:45 - 17:15 5.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6530' TO 6550'

SLIDE FROM 6550' TO 6557'
ROTATE FROM 6557' TO 6562'

17:15 - 17:30 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6514', 61.2 DEG, 123.8 AZ
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6562' TO 6568'

04/20/98 18:00 - 20:15 2.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6568' TO 6586'
SLIDE FROM 6586' TO 6594'

20:15 - 20:30 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6546', 63.1 DEG, 122.7 AZ
20:30 - 22:30 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6594' TO 6624'
22:30 - 22:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6577', 63.9 DEG, 123.7 AZ
22:45 - 01:30 2.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6624' TO 6655'
01:30 - 01:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6608', 64.4 DEG, 123.4 AZ
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Event Name: REN Start: 04/08/98 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Activity Code Phase Description of Operations

04/20/98 01:45 - 04:00 2.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6655' TO 6681'
04:00 - 06:00 2.00 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE FOR TRIP OUT
06:00 - 07:30 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT FOR BIT
07:30 - 09:30 2.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 CHANGE OUT BIT AND BHA
09:30 - 12:30 3.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE
12:30 - 13:00 0.50 REAM P SDTRK1 WASH AND REAM 30' TO BOTTOM
13:00 - 13:30 0.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6681' TO 6684'
13:30 - 13:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6635', 64.2 DEG, 125.5 AZ
13:45 - 18:00 4.25 DIRW P SDTRKi ROTATE FROM 6684' TO 6715'

04/21/98 18:00 - 18:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6666', 63.1 DEG, 125.5 AZ
18:15 - 23:45 5.50 DRL P SDTRK1 SLIDE FROM 6715' TO 6724'

ROTATE FROM 6724' TO 6747'
23:45 - 00:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6698', 62.6 DEG, 125.5 AZ
00:00 - 04:45 4.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6747' TO 6767'

SLIDE FROM 6767' TO 6777'
ROTATE FROM 677T TO 6779'

04:45 - 05:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6729', 62.4 DEG, 125.5 AZ
05:00 - 08:30 3.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6779' TO 6810'
08:30 - 08:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6761', 62.1 DEG, 126.3 AZ
08:45 - 11:15 2.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 SLIDE FROM 6810' TO 6823'

ROTATE FROM 6823' TO 6844'
11:15 - 11:30 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6792', 62.2 DEG, 126.2 AZ
11:30 - 14:45 3.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6844' TO 6873'
14:45 - 15:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6824', 62.8 DEG, 126.2 AZ
15:00 - 18:00 3.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 SLIDE FROM 6873' TO 6885'

ROTATE FROM 6885' TO 6888'
04/22/98 18:00 - 18:45 0.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING FROM 6888' TO 690T, 19', 25.3'lHR.

18:45 - 19:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @6855'. 63 INC, 125 AZ.
19:00 - 21:00 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 6907' TO 6936', 29',14.5'lHR.
21:00 - 21:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @688T, 63.2 INC, 124.8 AZ.
21:15 - 23:15 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 6936' TO 6967', 31', 15.5'lHR.
23:15 - 23:30 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @6918', 62.6 INC, 124.8 AZ
23:30 - 01:45 2.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 6967' TO 6998', 31', 13.T/HR.
01:45 - 02:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @6949', 61.3 INC, 124.1 AZ
02:00 -03:45 1.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 6998' TO 7013', 15', 8.5'lHR. TOOL FACE

20 DEGREES LEFT.
03:45 - 05:45 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7013' TO 7029', 16', 8'lHR.
05:45 - 06:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @6980', 60.2 INC, 124.1 AZ.
06:00 -07:00 1.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7020' TO 7049', 20', 20'lHR.
07:00 -09:00 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7049' TO 7061', 12', 6'lHR. TOOL FACE 20

DEGREES LEFT.
09:00 - 09:30 0.50 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7012', 60.9 INC, 124.4 AZ.
09:30 - 11:30 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7061' TO 7090', 29', 14.5'lHR.
11:30 - 11:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @ 7041', 61 INC, 124.1' AZ.
11:45 - 15:00 3.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7090' TO 7110', 20', 6.1'lHR. TOOL FACE

LEFT 20 DEGREES.
15:00 - 15:30 0.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7110' TO 7122', 12', 24'lHR.
15:30 - 15:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7073', 62.1 INC, 123.4 AZ.
15:45 - 18:00 2.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7122' TO 7145', 23', 10.2'lHR.

04/23/98 18:00 - 18:15 0.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7145' TO 7153', 8', 32'lHR.
18:15 - 18:30 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7104', 64 INC, 123.4 AZ.
18:30 - 19:30 1.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING,ROTATE FROM 7153' TO 7185', 32', 32'lHR.
19:30 - 19:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @ 7136', 63.5 INC, 122.7 AZ.
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Event Name: REN Start: 04/08/98 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Activity Code Phase Description of Operations

04/20/98 01:45 - 04:00 2.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6655' TO 6681'
04:00 - 06:00 2.00 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE FOR TRIP OUT
06:00 - 07:30 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT FOR BIT
07:30 - 09:30 2.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 CHANGE OUT BIT AND BHA
09:30 - 12:30 3.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE
12:30 - 13:00 0.50 REAM P SDTRK1 WASH AND REAM 30' TO BOTTOM
13:00 - 13:30 0.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6681' TO 6684'
13:30 - 13:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6635', 64.2 DEG, 125.5 AZ
13:45 - 18:00 4.25 DIRW P SDTRKi ROTATE FROM 6684' TO 6715'

04/21/98 18:00 - 18:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6666', 63.1 DEG, 125.5 AZ
18:15 - 23:45 5.50 DRL P SDTRK1 SLIDE FROM 6715' TO 6724'

ROTATE FROM 6724' TO 6747'
23:45 - 00:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6698', 62.6 DEG, 125.5 AZ
00:00 - 04:45 4.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6747' TO 6767'

SLIDE FROM 6767' TO 6777'
ROTATE FROM 677T TO 6779'

04:45 - 05:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6729', 62.4 DEG, 125.5 AZ
05:00 - 08:30 3.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6779' TO 6810'
08:30 - 08:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6761', 62.1 DEG, 126.3 AZ
08:45 - 11:15 2.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 SLIDE FROM 6810' TO 6823'

ROTATE FROM 6823' TO 6844'
11:15 - 11:30 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6792', 62.2 DEG, 126.2 AZ
11:30 - 14:45 3.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 ROTATE FROM 6844' TO 6873'
14:45 - 15:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY AT 6824', 62.8 DEG, 126.2 AZ
15:00 - 18:00 3.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 SLIDE FROM 6873' TO 6885'

ROTATE FROM 6885' TO 6888'
04/22/98 18:00 - 18:45 0.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING FROM 6888' TO 690T, 19', 25.3'lHR.

18:45 - 19:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @6855'. 63 INC, 125 AZ.
19:00 - 21:00 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 6907' TO 6936', 29',14.5'lHR.
21:00 - 21:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @688T, 63.2 INC, 124.8 AZ.
21:15 - 23:15 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 6936' TO 6967', 31', 15.5'lHR.
23:15 - 23:30 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @6918', 62.6 INC, 124.8 AZ
23:30 - 01:45 2.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 6967' TO 6998', 31', 13.T/HR.
01:45 - 02:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @6949', 61.3 INC, 124.1 AZ
02:00 -03:45 1.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 6998' TO 7013', 15', 8.5'lHR. TOOL FACE

20 DEGREES LEFT.
03:45 - 05:45 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7013' TO 7029', 16', 8'lHR.
05:45 - 06:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @6980', 60.2 INC, 124.1 AZ.
06:00 -07:00 1.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7020' TO 7049', 20', 20'lHR.
07:00 -09:00 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7049' TO 7061', 12', 6'lHR. TOOL FACE 20

DEGREES LEFT.
09:00 - 09:30 0.50 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7012', 60.9 INC, 124.4 AZ.
09:30 - 11:30 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7061' TO 7090', 29', 14.5'lHR.
11:30 - 11:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @ 7041', 61 INC, 124.1' AZ.
11:45 - 15:00 3.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7090' TO 7110', 20', 6.1'lHR. TOOL FACE

LEFT 20 DEGREES.
15:00 - 15:30 0.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7110' TO 7122', 12', 24'lHR.
15:30 - 15:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7073', 62.1 INC, 123.4 AZ.
15:45 - 18:00 2.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7122' TO 7145', 23', 10.2'lHR.

04/23/98 18:00 - 18:15 0.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7145' TO 7153', 8', 32'lHR.
18:15 - 18:30 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7104', 64 INC, 123.4 AZ.
18:30 - 19:30 1.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING,ROTATE FROM 7153' TO 7185', 32', 32'lHR.
19:30 - 19:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @ 7136', 63.5 INC, 122.7 AZ.
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1
Common Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1 Spud Date:
Event Name: REN Start: 04/08/98 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Activity Code Phase Description of Operations

04/23/98 19:45 - 21:45 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7185' TO 7201', 16', 8'/HR.
21:45 - 00:30 2.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7201' TO 7216', 15', 5.4'lHR. TOOL FACE 20

DEGREES LEFT.
00:30 - 00:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7167', 62.7 INC, 123.4 AZ.
00:45 - 02:15 1.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING,ROTATE FROM 7216' TO 7233', 17', 11.3'lHR.
02:15 - 05:00 2.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7233' TO 7248', 15', 5.4'lHR. TOOL FACE

20 DEGREES LEFT.
05:00 -05:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @ 7199', 61.6 INC, 123.4 AZ.
05:15 - 07:00 1.75 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE, SPOT LCM PILL.
07:00 - 10:00 3.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP FOR BIT #6, CHANGE BHA.
10:00 - 10:30 0.50 RIGSER P SDTRK1 SERVICE RIG.
10:30 - 13:30 3.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 REPLACE MUD MOTOR, INSTALLWEAR RING. FUNCTION TEST

BOP.
13:30 - 16:30 3.00 MISC P SDTRK1 CLEAN MUD PITS, CHANGE LIME MUD OVER TO POLYMER MUD.
16:30 - 18:00 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TIH, STRAP PIPE, BHA NOT RIGHT ON TRIP OUT.

04/24/98 18:00 - 19:00 1.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE, STRAP PIPE.
19:00 - 22:30 3.50 TUBMOUP SDTRK1 PICK UP 39 JOINTS DRILL PIPE.
22:30 - 00:00 1.50 CIRC P SDTRK1 DISPLACE LIME MUD OUT OF HOLE WIPOLYMER MUD.
00:00 - 03:00 3.00 MISC T SDTRK1 REPLACE HYDRAULIC PUMP ON TOP DRIVE.
03:00 - 05:15 2.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7248' TO 7266', 18', 8'/HR.
05:15 -09:30 4.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7266' TO 7282', 16', 3.7'lHR. TOOL FACE

20 DEGREES LEFT.
09:30 -09:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7229', 62 INC, 123.4 AZ.
09:45 - 11:45 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7282' TO 7297', 15', 7.5'lHR.
11:45 - 12:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 TOOL FACE ORIENTATION.
12:00 - 14:15 2.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7297' TO 7315', 18', 8'lHR. TOOL FACE 20

DEGREES LEFT.
14:15 - 14:30 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @ 7261', 62.9 INC, 123.7 AZ.
14:30 - 16:00 1.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7315' TO 7329', 14', 9.3'lHR.
16:00 - 18:00 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7329' TO 7332', 3', 1.5'lHR. TOOL FACE 20

DEGREES LEFT.
18:00 - SDTRK1 NOTE: HOLE TIGHT FOR FEW MINUTES IN TOP OF SLIDEROCK

FORMATION. TOTAL MUD LOST TODAY 50 BBLS. GAS KICKAT
7334 MD, PEAK 293 UNITS. BG 35 UNITS.

04/25/98 18:00 - 21:30 3.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7332' TO 7341', 9', 2.5'lHR. TOOL FACE 20
DEGREES LEFT.

21:30 - 21:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7292', 64.4 INC, 124.1 AZ.
21:45 - 23:15 1.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7341' TO 7349', 8', 5.3'lHR. TOOL FACE 20

DEGREES LEFT.
23:15 - 00:15 1.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7349' TO 7356', 7', 7'/HR.
00:15 - 04:30 4.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7356' TO 7376', 20', 4.7'lHR. TOOL FACE 20

DEGREES LEFT.
04:30 - 04:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7323', 66.8 INC, 125.3 AZ.
04:45 - 07:00 2.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7376' TO 7391', 15', 6.6'lHR.
07:00 - 09:45 2.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7391' TO 7403', 13', 4.7'lHR. TOOL FACE

48 DEGREES LEFT.
09:45 - 10:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7354', 69.7 INC, 126.2 AZ.
10:00 - 13:30 3.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7403' TO 7422', 19', 5.4'IHR.
13:30 - 13:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7385', 73.1 INC, 125.9 AZ.
13:45 - 17:00 3.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7422' TO 7434', 12', 3.6'lHR.TOOL FACE 48

DEGREES LEFT.
17:00 - 18:00 1.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7434' TO 7438', 4', 4'lHR.

- SDTRK1 NOTE: TOTAL MUD LOSS LAST 24 HRS. 47 BBLS. AVG. 1.95
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04/23/98 19:45 - 21:45 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7185' TO 7201', 16', 8'/HR.
21:45 - 00:30 2.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7201' TO 7216', 15', 5.4'lHR. TOOL FACE 20

DEGREES LEFT.
00:30 - 00:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7167', 62.7 INC, 123.4 AZ.
00:45 - 02:15 1.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING,ROTATE FROM 7216' TO 7233', 17', 11.3'lHR.
02:15 - 05:00 2.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7233' TO 7248', 15', 5.4'lHR. TOOL FACE

20 DEGREES LEFT.
05:00 -05:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @ 7199', 61.6 INC, 123.4 AZ.
05:15 - 07:00 1.75 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE, SPOT LCM PILL.
07:00 - 10:00 3.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP FOR BIT #6, CHANGE BHA.
10:00 - 10:30 0.50 RIGSER P SDTRK1 SERVICE RIG.
10:30 - 13:30 3.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 REPLACE MUD MOTOR, INSTALLWEAR RING. FUNCTION TEST

BOP.
13:30 - 16:30 3.00 MISC P SDTRK1 CLEAN MUD PITS, CHANGE LIME MUD OVER TO POLYMER MUD.
16:30 - 18:00 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TIH, STRAP PIPE, BHA NOT RIGHT ON TRIP OUT.

04/24/98 18:00 - 19:00 1.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE, STRAP PIPE.
19:00 - 22:30 3.50 TUBMOUP SDTRK1 PICK UP 39 JOINTS DRILL PIPE.
22:30 - 00:00 1.50 CIRC P SDTRK1 DISPLACE LIME MUD OUT OF HOLE WIPOLYMER MUD.
00:00 - 03:00 3.00 MISC T SDTRK1 REPLACE HYDRAULIC PUMP ON TOP DRIVE.
03:00 - 05:15 2.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7248' TO 7266', 18', 8'/HR.
05:15 -09:30 4.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7266' TO 7282', 16', 3.7'lHR. TOOL FACE

20 DEGREES LEFT.
09:30 -09:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7229', 62 INC, 123.4 AZ.
09:45 - 11:45 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7282' TO 7297', 15', 7.5'lHR.
11:45 - 12:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 TOOL FACE ORIENTATION.
12:00 - 14:15 2.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7297' TO 7315', 18', 8'lHR. TOOL FACE 20

DEGREES LEFT.
14:15 - 14:30 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @ 7261', 62.9 INC, 123.7 AZ.
14:30 - 16:00 1.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7315' TO 7329', 14', 9.3'lHR.
16:00 - 18:00 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7329' TO 7332', 3', 1.5'lHR. TOOL FACE 20

DEGREES LEFT.
18:00 - SDTRK1 NOTE: HOLE TIGHT FOR FEW MINUTES IN TOP OF SLIDEROCK

FORMATION. TOTAL MUD LOST TODAY 50 BBLS. GAS KICKAT
7334 MD, PEAK 293 UNITS. BG 35 UNITS.

04/25/98 18:00 - 21:30 3.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7332' TO 7341', 9', 2.5'lHR. TOOL FACE 20
DEGREES LEFT.

21:30 - 21:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7292', 64.4 INC, 124.1 AZ.
21:45 - 23:15 1.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7341' TO 7349', 8', 5.3'lHR. TOOL FACE 20

DEGREES LEFT.
23:15 - 00:15 1.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7349' TO 7356', 7', 7'/HR.
00:15 - 04:30 4.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7356' TO 7376', 20', 4.7'lHR. TOOL FACE 20

DEGREES LEFT.
04:30 - 04:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7323', 66.8 INC, 125.3 AZ.
04:45 - 07:00 2.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7376' TO 7391', 15', 6.6'lHR.
07:00 - 09:45 2.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7391' TO 7403', 13', 4.7'lHR. TOOL FACE

48 DEGREES LEFT.
09:45 - 10:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7354', 69.7 INC, 126.2 AZ.
10:00 - 13:30 3.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7403' TO 7422', 19', 5.4'IHR.
13:30 - 13:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7385', 73.1 INC, 125.9 AZ.
13:45 - 17:00 3.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7422' TO 7434', 12', 3.6'lHR.TOOL FACE 48

DEGREES LEFT.
17:00 - 18:00 1.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7434' TO 7438', 4', 4'lHR.

- SDTRK1 NOTE: TOTAL MUD LOSS LAST 24 HRS. 47 BBLS. AVG. 1.95

Printed: 05/27/98 1:00:37



AMOCO PRODUCTION Page 6 of 13

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1
Common Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1 Spud Date:
Event Name: REN Start: 04/08/98 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Activity Code Phase Description of Operations

04/25/98 - SDTRK1 BBLS/HR.
04/26/98 18:00 - 19:15 1.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7438' TO 7454', 16', 12.8'lHR.

19:15 - 22:00 2.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7454' TO 7464', 10', 3.6'lHR.
22:00 - 23:00 1.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7464' TO 7466, 2', 2'lHR.
23:00 - 23:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @741T, 75.3 INC, 124.8 AZ.
23:15 - 01:45 2.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7466' TO 7484', 18', 7.2'lHR.
01:45 - 04:00 2.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7484' TO 7489', 5', 2.2'/HR.
04:00 -04:30 0.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7489' TO 7491', 2', 4'lHR.
04:30 -05:30 1.00 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE, PUMP PILL FOR BIT TRIP.
05:30 - 06:00 0.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TOH
06:00 - 06:15 0.25 RIGSER P SDTRK1 SERVICE RIG.
06:15 - 08:15 2.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TOH
08:15 - 12:15 4.00 MISC P SDTRK1 LAY DOWN & PICK UP MUD MOTOR, TEST MOTOR, INSPECT BHA,

CHANGE CORROSION RING IN TOP DRIVE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE.
12:15 - 14:30 2.25 TRIP P SDTRK1 TIH 3900', TEST MUD MOTOR.
14:30 - 16:30 2.00 MISC P SDTRK1 SLIP & CUT DRILLING LINE. HAD TO MOVE BLOCK HANGING LINE

TO ACCOMIDATE TOP DRIVE, SAFETY MEETING. DON'T TAKE ANY
RISK THAT MIGHT CAUSE INJURY.

16:30 - 18:00 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TlH
04/27/98 18:00 - 19:30 1.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7491' TO 7494', 3', 2'/HR.

19:30 - 19:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7744, 77.4 INC, 125.5 AZ.
19:45 - 00:00 4.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7494' TO 7524', 30', T/HR.
00:00 - 00:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7475', 78.3 INC, 124.1 AZ.
00:15 - 04:00 3.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7524' TO 7556', 32', 8.5'lHR.
04:00 -04:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7507', 78.6 INC, 125 AZ.
04:15 - 07:30 3.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7556' TO 7587', 31', 9.5'lHR.
07:30 - 08:00 0.50 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7538, 78.9 INC,124.8 AZ.
08:00 - 09:30 1.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 758T TO7593', 6', 4'lHR. TOOL FACE 60

DEGREES LEFT.
09:30 - 12:30 3.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7593' TO 7618', 25', 8.3'lHR.
12:30 - 12:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7559', 79 INC, 124.1 AZ.
12:45 - 15:30 2.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7618' TO 7649', 31', 11.2'/HR.
15:30 - 16:00 0.50 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @ 7600', 79.7 INC, 124.1 AZ.
16:00 - 18:00 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7649' TO 7670', 21', 10.5'lHR.
18:00 - SDTRK1 NOTE: LOST 76 BBLS MUD TO FORMATION, 3.1 BBLS/HR.

04/28/98 18:00 - 18:45 0.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING,ROTATE FROM 7670' TO 7680', 10', 13.3'lHR.
18:45 - 19:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7631', 80.2 INC, 122.7 AZ.
19:00 - 22:00 3.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7680' TO 7711', 31', 10.3'lHR.
22:00 - 22:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @ 7662', 80.8 INC, 122.6 AZ.
22:15 - 02:15 4.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7711' TO 7743', 32', 8'lHR.
02:15 - 02:30 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7694', 80.7 INC, 122.4 AZ.
02:30 - 03:15 0.75 DIRW T SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7743' TO 7757', 14', 18.6'lHR.
03:15 -06:00 2.75 CIRC T SDTRK1 LOST 72 BBLS MUD FROM 2400 HRS. TO 0315 HRS. STARTED

MAKE UP WATER @ 0230 HRS. 0300 HRS, STOP DRILLING, PICK UP
OFF BOTTOM, WORK PIPE & ROTATE, SLOW PUMP FROM 95 SPM
TO 80 SPM, PUMP TWO LCM PILLS, PILLS CONTAINING PER BBL,
15# BARACARB #5, 15# BARACARB #50, 15# BARACARB #150, 10#
MAGMA FIBER. EACH PILL VOLUME 60 BBLS. 0500 HRS. START
MIXINGCORSE MICA & FINE WALNUT @ 2.5 MINUTES PER SACK.
LOSS @0600 HRS. 10 BBLS/HR.

06:00 - 07:00 1.00 CIRC T SDTRK1 0600 HRS. PIT VOLUME 610 BBLS.MAKE UP WATER 10 BBLS/HR.
0630 HRS. LOSS INCREASE TO 18 BBLS/HR. SLOW PUMP TO 70
SPM. @ 0630 HRS. PIT VOLUME 606 BBLS. 0700 HRS. PIT VOLUME

'
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04/25/98 - SDTRK1 BBLS/HR.
04/26/98 18:00 - 19:15 1.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7438' TO 7454', 16', 12.8'lHR.

19:15 - 22:00 2.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7454' TO 7464', 10', 3.6'lHR.
22:00 - 23:00 1.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7464' TO 7466, 2', 2'lHR.
23:00 - 23:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @741T, 75.3 INC, 124.8 AZ.
23:15 - 01:45 2.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7466' TO 7484', 18', 7.2'lHR.
01:45 - 04:00 2.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7484' TO 7489', 5', 2.2'/HR.
04:00 -04:30 0.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7489' TO 7491', 2', 4'lHR.
04:30 -05:30 1.00 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE, PUMP PILL FOR BIT TRIP.
05:30 - 06:00 0.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TOH
06:00 - 06:15 0.25 RIGSER P SDTRK1 SERVICE RIG.
06:15 - 08:15 2.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TOH
08:15 - 12:15 4.00 MISC P SDTRK1 LAY DOWN & PICK UP MUD MOTOR, TEST MOTOR, INSPECT BHA,

CHANGE CORROSION RING IN TOP DRIVE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE.
12:15 - 14:30 2.25 TRIP P SDTRK1 TIH 3900', TEST MUD MOTOR.
14:30 - 16:30 2.00 MISC P SDTRK1 SLIP & CUT DRILLING LINE. HAD TO MOVE BLOCK HANGING LINE

TO ACCOMIDATE TOP DRIVE, SAFETY MEETING. DON'T TAKE ANY
RISK THAT MIGHT CAUSE INJURY.

16:30 - 18:00 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TlH
04/27/98 18:00 - 19:30 1.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7491' TO 7494', 3', 2'/HR.

19:30 - 19:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7744, 77.4 INC, 125.5 AZ.
19:45 - 00:00 4.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7494' TO 7524', 30', T/HR.
00:00 - 00:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7475', 78.3 INC, 124.1 AZ.
00:15 - 04:00 3.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7524' TO 7556', 32', 8.5'lHR.
04:00 -04:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7507', 78.6 INC, 125 AZ.
04:15 - 07:30 3.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7556' TO 7587', 31', 9.5'lHR.
07:30 - 08:00 0.50 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7538, 78.9 INC,124.8 AZ.
08:00 - 09:30 1.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 758T TO7593', 6', 4'lHR. TOOL FACE 60

DEGREES LEFT.
09:30 - 12:30 3.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7593' TO 7618', 25', 8.3'lHR.
12:30 - 12:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7559', 79 INC, 124.1 AZ.
12:45 - 15:30 2.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7618' TO 7649', 31', 11.2'/HR.
15:30 - 16:00 0.50 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @ 7600', 79.7 INC, 124.1 AZ.
16:00 - 18:00 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7649' TO 7670', 21', 10.5'lHR.
18:00 - SDTRK1 NOTE: LOST 76 BBLS MUD TO FORMATION, 3.1 BBLS/HR.

04/28/98 18:00 - 18:45 0.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING,ROTATE FROM 7670' TO 7680', 10', 13.3'lHR.
18:45 - 19:00 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7631', 80.2 INC, 122.7 AZ.
19:00 - 22:00 3.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7680' TO 7711', 31', 10.3'lHR.
22:00 - 22:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @ 7662', 80.8 INC, 122.6 AZ.
22:15 - 02:15 4.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7711' TO 7743', 32', 8'lHR.
02:15 - 02:30 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7694', 80.7 INC, 122.4 AZ.
02:30 - 03:15 0.75 DIRW T SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7743' TO 7757', 14', 18.6'lHR.
03:15 -06:00 2.75 CIRC T SDTRK1 LOST 72 BBLS MUD FROM 2400 HRS. TO 0315 HRS. STARTED

MAKE UP WATER @ 0230 HRS. 0300 HRS, STOP DRILLING, PICK UP
OFF BOTTOM, WORK PIPE & ROTATE, SLOW PUMP FROM 95 SPM
TO 80 SPM, PUMP TWO LCM PILLS, PILLS CONTAINING PER BBL,
15# BARACARB #5, 15# BARACARB #50, 15# BARACARB #150, 10#
MAGMA FIBER. EACH PILL VOLUME 60 BBLS. 0500 HRS. START
MIXINGCORSE MICA & FINE WALNUT @ 2.5 MINUTES PER SACK.
LOSS @0600 HRS. 10 BBLS/HR.

06:00 - 07:00 1.00 CIRC T SDTRK1 0600 HRS. PIT VOLUME 610 BBLS.MAKE UP WATER 10 BBLS/HR.
0630 HRS. LOSS INCREASE TO 18 BBLS/HR. SLOW PUMP TO 70
SPM. @ 0630 HRS. PIT VOLUME 606 BBLS. 0700 HRS. PIT VOLUME

'
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1
Common Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1 Spud Date:
Event Name: REN Start: 04/08/98 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Activity Code Phase Description of Operations

04/28/98 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 CIRC T SDTRK1 601 BBLS. MUD LOSS 20 BBLS./HR. INCLUDES MAKE UP WATER.
07:00 -09:00 2.00 CIRC T SDTRK1 PUMP 60 BBL PILL CONTAINING PER BBL, 15# BARACARB #5, 15#

BARACARB #50, 15# BARACARB #150, 10# MAGMA FIBER, 15#
BARACARB 600. NO SUCCESS. MUD LOSS 20+ BBLS./HR.

09:00 - 11:00 2.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TOH WlDRILLING ASSEMBLY. LAY DOWN MWD, CLEAN UP SAME.
11:00 - 12:30 1.50 MISC P SDTRK1 ENGINEERING MEETING, PLANNING TO CONTROL MUD LOSSES.
12:30 - 13:00 0.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 MOVE BHA TO OTHER SIDE OF DERRICK, PICK UP 3 JTS. DP.
13:00 - 14:00 1.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE OPEN END. SHUT DOWN @WINDOW, WAIT ON

CEMENT SERVICE.
14:00 - 18:00 4.00 MISC T SDTRK1 WAIT ON CEMENT SERVICE FROM DS.

04/29/98 18:00 - 20:30 2.50 MISC T SDTRK1 WAIT ON DS SERVICES.
20:30 - 21:30 1.00 CMTPLG P SDTRK1 RIG UP CEMENTERS.
21:30 - 22:00 0.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN OPEN HOLE FROM WINDOW.
22:00 - 22:30 0.50 CIRC P SDTRK1 FILL HOLE WlMUD, FLUID LEVEL 2700' FROM SURFACE.
22:30 - 00:00 1.50 CMTPLG P SDTRK1 PUMP LOST CIRCULATION CEMENT PLUG.
00:00 -00:30 0.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TOH 20 STANDS.
00:30 - 02:00 1.50 CIRC P SDTRK1 REVERSE CIRCULATE, LOST 6 BBLS. FIRST 30 MINUTES, NO MUD

LOSS LAST HOUR. CIRCULATING PRESSURE 300 PSI @89 GPM.
02:00 - 03:45 1.75 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT W/DP.
03:45 - 05:00 1.25 TRIP P SDTRK1 PICK UP DIRECTIONAL DRG. BHA.
05:00 - 07:00 2.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TEST MUD MOTOR & MWD, GET PIECE OF WOOD OUT OF MWD.
07:00 - 08:15 1.25 TRIP P SDTRK1 TIH, STRING STARTED TAKING WEIGHT @ 6450',
08:15 - 17:00 8.75 REAM P SDTRK1 WASH & REAM FROM 6450' TO 7757', SEVERAL BRIDGES, SOFT,

SPONGE TYPE REAMING, 2,000 TO 10,000 BIT WEIGHT TO REAM
DOWN. NO CEMENT DRILLED.

17:00 - 18:00 1.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDING FROM 7757' TO 7760'.
04/30/98 18:00 - 21:30 3.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDE FROM 7760' TO 7775', 15', 4.2'lHR. TOOL FACE 30

DEGREES LEFT.
21:30 - 21:45 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @7726', 80.2 INC, 122.7 AZ.
21:45 - 00:00 2.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7775' TO 7791', 14', 6.2'lHR.
00:00 -05:00 5.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING,SLIDE FROM 7791' TO 7806', 15', 3'lHR. TOOL FACE 30

DEGREES LEFT.
05:00 - 06:30 1.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7806' TO 7824', 18', 12'lHR.
06:30 - 08:30 2.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDE FROM 7824' TO 7827', 3', 1.5'lHR.
08:30 -09:00 0.50 CIRC P SDTRK1 NOT SLIDING GOOD, PICK UP, PULL 80,000 OVER BEFORE PIPE

FREE, MIXAND PUMP 40 BBL PILL CONTAINING PER BARREL; 3#
BARABUF, 15# BARACARB 5, 15# BARACARB 15, 15# BARACARB
150, 5# BARACARB 600, 7# ENVIRO-TORQ.ONE SACK N-VIS IN PILL.

REDUCE DRAG FROM 80,000 TO 20,000.
09:00 - 10:00 1.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, SLIDE FROM 7827' TO 7829', 2', 2'lHR. TOOL FACE 30

DEGREES LEFT.
10:00 - 11:00 1.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 7829' TO 7837', 8', 8'lHR.
11:00 - 11:15 0.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @ 7788', 81.8 INC, 123.4 AZ.
11:15 - 12:00 0.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING, ROTATE FROM 783T TO 7843', 6', 8'lHR. 12:00 LOST

TOTAL CIRCULATION, PULL ONE STAND.
12:00 - 13:30 1.50 CIRC T SDTRK1 PUMP 60 BBL LCM PILL, NO RETURNS.
13:30 - 14:15 0.75 TRIP T SDTRK1 TOH 26 STANDS.
14:15 - 16:15 2.00 MISC T SDTRK1 MIX LCM PILL IN PREMIX TANK.
16:15 - 17:30 1.25 TRIP P SDTRK1 TIH 26 STANDS.
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 CIRC T SDTRK1 TRY TO SPOT LCM PILL, MWD PLUGGED.
18:00 - SDTRK1 NOTE: TOTAL MUD LOST LAST 24 HOURS. 348 BBLS. FIRST 18 HRS.

TOTAL 77 BBLS. 12:00 TO 13:30 LOST TOTAL RETURN, LOST LCM
PILLS, FROM 12:00 TO 13:30, 271 BBLS.
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1
Common Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1 Spud Date:
Event Name: REN Start: 04/08/98 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Activity Code Phase Description of Operations

05/01/98 18:00 - 20:30 2.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIPPING OUT OF HOLE, WET STRING, MWD PLUGGED. WELL
STARTED FLOWING. SHUT WELL IN.

20:30 - 23:30 3.00 MISC T SDTRK1 PREPARE TO KILLWELL, SICP 850 PSI. KILLWELL Wl246 BBLS.
23:30 - 00:00 0.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 PULL PLUGGED BHA OUT OF HOLE.
00:00 -02:30 2.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE WIKILLSTRING TO 4300'.
02:30 - 11:00 8.50 MISC P SDTRK1 MIX MUD. BUILDVOLUME.
11:00 - 12:00 1.00 CIRC P SDTRK1 SIDP 900 PSI, SICP 250 PSI. PUMP 36 BBLS DOWN CSG, 55 BBLS

DOWN DP. LINE UP ON GAS BUSTER, CIRCULATE ONE HOUR.
12:00 - 14:00 2.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE 36 STANDS.
14:00 - 14:30 0.50 CMTPLG P SDTRK1 RIG UP CEMENT EQUIPMENT.
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 CMTPLGP SDTRK1 SPOT 50 SACK CEMENT.
15:00 - 16:00 1.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 PULL 26 STANDS.
16:00 - 17:00 1.00 WOC P SDTRK1 WAITING ON CEMENT.
17:00 - 18:00 1.00 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE GAS OUT OF MUD.
18:00 - SDTRK1 NOTE: TOTAL MUD LOSS, LAST 24 HRS. 348 BBLS. FLUID LEVEL @

1700 HRS. 2700'. 20 BBLS TO LOAD DP.
05/02/98 18:00 - 19:30 1.50 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE GAS OUT OF HOLE.

19:30 - 21:00 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT FOR DRILLINGASSEMBLY.
21:00 - 22:30 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 PICK UP CONVENTIONAL ROTARY BUILDING ASSEMBLY.
22:30 - 01:00 2.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE, BRIDGE @6791'.
01:00 - 01:30 0.50 REAM T SDTRK1 WASH & REAM 90'.
01:30 -02:00 0.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE.
02:00 -03:30 1.50 REAM P SDTRK1 TAG CEMENT @7628', REAM TO TD @7843. CEMENT FIRM, NOT

HARD. ONLY 12 SACKS CALCULATED TO BE IN FORMATION IF
HOLE IN GAUGE.

03:30 - 15:00 11.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING FROM 7843' TO 7925', 82', 7.1'lHR. PUMPING LCM
SWEEPS ABOUT EVERY 3 HRS. SLOWING LOSS FROM 10 BBLS/HR.
TO 6 BBLS/HR. TOTAL LOSS RETURNS @7925'.

15:00 - 16:00 1.00 MISC P SDTRK1 SHUT PUMP DOWN, PULL ONE STAND, PUMP LCM PILL.
16:00 - 17:00 1.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TOH Wl27 STANDS
17:00 - 17:30 0.50 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE, REGAINFULL RETURN.
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 WIRELN P SDTRK1 RUN MWD & LOGGING TOOL IN TO UBHO ON SLICK LINE.
18:00 - SDTRK1 NOTE: MUD LOSS TODAY 350 BBLS.

05/03/98 18:00 - 18:30 0.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP UBHO TO VERTICAL POSITION.
18:30 - 00:00 5.50 WIRELN T SDTRK1 RUN MWD & LOGGING TOOL ON SLICK LINE. TOOL STOPPED @

HWDP. TRY TO COME OUT OF HOLE, SHEARED OFF OF TOOL. LAY
TOOL DOWN, ADJUST BOW SPRING TENSION, TRIP IN HOLE, TOOL
STOPPED @7700', TOOL STUCK, SHEARED OFF, TOH WIDP.
FOUND TOOL @ 7700', DROPPED TOOL TRYING TO GET IT OUT OF
DP. TOH TO UBHO, RECOVER TOOL. CHUNKS OF CEMENT
COMING OFF DP, CAUSING PROBLEM.

00:00 -03:00 3.00 MISC P SDTRK1 WORK ON MWD.
03:00 - 06:00 3.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TlH, RABBIT DRILL PIPE.
06:00 - 06:30 0.50 CIRC P SDTRK1 TEST MWD.
06:30 - 07:00 0.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE, BRIDGE @ 7737'.
07:00 - 08:00 1.00 REAM P SDTRK1 WASH 188' TO BOTTOM.
08:00 - 10:30 2.50 LOG P SDTRK1 RUN GAMMA RAY LOG FROM TOP OF NUGGET TO TD.
10:30 - 12:00 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 PULL UBHO BACK TO VERTICAL POSITION.
12:00 - 13:30 1.50 WIRELN P SDTRK1 PULL MWD WISLICK LINE.
13:30 - 14:30 1.00 MISC P SDTRK1 CHANGE CORROSION RING IN TOP DRIVE, CHANGE DIES IN TOP

DRIVE SAVER SUB.
14:30 - 15:30 1.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE.
15:30 - 18:00 2.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLINGWICONVENTIONAL ROTARY BUILDASSEMBLY FROM
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03:00 - 06:00 3.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TlH, RABBIT DRILL PIPE.
06:00 - 06:30 0.50 CIRC P SDTRK1 TEST MWD.
06:30 - 07:00 0.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE, BRIDGE @ 7737'.
07:00 - 08:00 1.00 REAM P SDTRK1 WASH 188' TO BOTTOM.
08:00 - 10:30 2.50 LOG P SDTRK1 RUN GAMMA RAY LOG FROM TOP OF NUGGET TO TD.
10:30 - 12:00 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 PULL UBHO BACK TO VERTICAL POSITION.
12:00 - 13:30 1.50 WIRELN P SDTRK1 PULL MWD WISLICK LINE.
13:30 - 14:30 1.00 MISC P SDTRK1 CHANGE CORROSION RING IN TOP DRIVE, CHANGE DIES IN TOP

DRIVE SAVER SUB.
14:30 - 15:30 1.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE.
15:30 - 18:00 2.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLINGWICONVENTIONAL ROTARY BUILDASSEMBLY FROM
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Legal Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1
Common Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1 Spud Date:
Event Name: REN Start: 04/08/98 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Activity Code Phase Description of Operations

05/03/98 15:30 - 18:00 2.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 7925' TO 7949'. 24', 9.6'/HR.
18:00 - SDTRK1 NOTE: MUD LOSS LAST 24 HRS. 352 BBLS. LOSS @ 1730 HRS. 12

BBLS/HR. PUMPED 60 BBL LCM PILL @1800 HRS. APPEARS TO
HAVE SLOWED LOSS DOWN TO 7 BBLS/HR.

SDTRK1 NOTE: CHANGED MUD SYSTEM OVER TO IMPERMEX (STARCH)
TODAY. RUNNING CONVENTIONAL LCM.

05/04/98 18:00 - 03:00 9.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING FROM 7949' TO 8043', 94', 10.4'lHR.
03:00 - 05:30 2.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TOH TO UBHO. RUN MWD IN ON SLICK LINE.
05:30 -07:00 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TIH TO SURVEY.
07:00 - 07:15 0.25 CIRC P SDTRK1 FILL PIPE.
07:15 - 09:30 2.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY WlMWD.
09:30 - 12:00 2.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TOH TO UBHO,PULL MWD ON SLICK LINE.
12:00 - 12:30 0.50 RIGSER P SDTRK1 SERVICE RIG.
12:30 - 14:00 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TOH TO CHANGEBHA CONFIGERATION.
14:00 - 14:30 0.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 PICK UP BHA DESIGNED TO HOLD ANGLE.
14:30 - 17:00 2.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TIH TO WINDOW.
17:00 - 18:00 1.00 RIGSER P SDTRK1 SLIP & CUT DRILLING LINE.

05/05/98 18:00 - 18:30 0.50 RIGSER P SDTRK1 SLIP & CUT DRILLING LINE.
18:30 - 19:00 0.50 RIGSER P SDTRK1 REGULAR RIGSERVICE.
19:00 - 21:00 2.00 REAM P SDTRK1 TIH FROM WINDOW, REAM AND BACK REAM LAST 90 FEET TO

DROP ANGLE. LAST SURVEY 90.5 DEGREES, PERFERED ANGLE 89
TO 90 DEGREES.

21:00 - 06:00 9.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING FROM 8043' TO 8120', 77', 8.5'lHR.
06:00 - 14:00 8.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING FROM 8120' TO 8169', 49', 6.1'lHR.
14:00 - 18:00 4.00 TRIP P SDTRK1

05/06/98 18:00 - 21:30 3.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TIH WIMWD.
21:30 - 22:00 0.50 REAM P SDTRK1 REAM 45' TO BOTTOM,
22:00 - 23:00 1.00 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @8075' & 8124'.
23:00-05:00 6.00 LOG P SDTRK1 LOGGING.
05:00 - 06:30 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIPPING UBHO TO VERTICAL TO PULL UBHO.
06:30 -07:45 1.25 WIRELN P SDTRK1 PULL MWD TOOLS WISLICK LINE
07:45 -09:00 1.25 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE TO 8169'
09:00 - 18:00 9.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8169' TO 8200', 3FT/HR

05/07/98 18:00 - 01:00 7.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8200' TO 8222', 3FT/HR
01:00 - 03:30 2.50 CIRC T SDTRK1 LOST 40 BBLS MUD, SPOT LCM PILL

PULL 2 STANDS, REGAINED RETURNS
RUN BACK TO BOTTOM

03:30 - 06:15 2.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8222' TO 8232', 3.5 FT/HR
SEEPAGE LOSSES AT 15 BBLS/HR

06:15 - 10:45 4.50 CIRC T SDTRK1 LOST TOTAL RETURNS AT 8232'
SPOT LCM PILL, REGAIN PARTIAL RETURNS, PULL 10 STANDS, MIX
MUD AND BUILDVOLUME, LET LCM SOAK ON BOTTOM, WORK
PIPE, BROKE CICULATION HAD FULL RETURNS
RUN BACK TO BOTTOM

10:45 - 18:00 7.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8232' TO 8258', 3.5FT/HR
SEEPAGE LOSSES APPROX 10 BBLS/HR

05/08/98 18:00 - 05:30 11.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8258' TO 8300', 3.6FT/HR
05:30 - 07:45 2.25 CIRC T SDTRK1 LOST 45 BBLS MUD, SPOT LCM PILL

PULL 5 STANDS, REGAIN CIRC.
RUN BACK TO BOTTOM

07:45 - 09:15 1.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8300' TO 8309', 6 FT/HR
09:15 - 12:30 3.25 CIRC T SDTRK1 LOSSINGMUDAT 20 + BBLS/HR

SPOT LCM PILL ON BOTTOM
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05/03/98 15:30 - 18:00 2.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 7925' TO 7949'. 24', 9.6'/HR.
18:00 - SDTRK1 NOTE: MUD LOSS LAST 24 HRS. 352 BBLS. LOSS @ 1730 HRS. 12

BBLS/HR. PUMPED 60 BBL LCM PILL @1800 HRS. APPEARS TO
HAVE SLOWED LOSS DOWN TO 7 BBLS/HR.

SDTRK1 NOTE: CHANGED MUD SYSTEM OVER TO IMPERMEX (STARCH)
TODAY. RUNNING CONVENTIONAL LCM.

05/04/98 18:00 - 03:00 9.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING FROM 7949' TO 8043', 94', 10.4'lHR.
03:00 - 05:30 2.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TOH TO UBHO. RUN MWD IN ON SLICK LINE.
05:30 -07:00 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TIH TO SURVEY.
07:00 - 07:15 0.25 CIRC P SDTRK1 FILL PIPE.
07:15 - 09:30 2.25 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY WlMWD.
09:30 - 12:00 2.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TOH TO UBHO,PULL MWD ON SLICK LINE.
12:00 - 12:30 0.50 RIGSER P SDTRK1 SERVICE RIG.
12:30 - 14:00 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TOH TO CHANGEBHA CONFIGERATION.
14:00 - 14:30 0.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 PICK UP BHA DESIGNED TO HOLD ANGLE.
14:30 - 17:00 2.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TIH TO WINDOW.
17:00 - 18:00 1.00 RIGSER P SDTRK1 SLIP & CUT DRILLING LINE.

05/05/98 18:00 - 18:30 0.50 RIGSER P SDTRK1 SLIP & CUT DRILLING LINE.
18:30 - 19:00 0.50 RIGSER P SDTRK1 REGULAR RIGSERVICE.
19:00 - 21:00 2.00 REAM P SDTRK1 TIH FROM WINDOW, REAM AND BACK REAM LAST 90 FEET TO

DROP ANGLE. LAST SURVEY 90.5 DEGREES, PERFERED ANGLE 89
TO 90 DEGREES.

21:00 - 06:00 9.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING FROM 8043' TO 8120', 77', 8.5'lHR.
06:00 - 14:00 8.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILLING FROM 8120' TO 8169', 49', 6.1'lHR.
14:00 - 18:00 4.00 TRIP P SDTRK1

05/06/98 18:00 - 21:30 3.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TIH WIMWD.
21:30 - 22:00 0.50 REAM P SDTRK1 REAM 45' TO BOTTOM,
22:00 - 23:00 1.00 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY @8075' & 8124'.
23:00-05:00 6.00 LOG P SDTRK1 LOGGING.
05:00 - 06:30 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIPPING UBHO TO VERTICAL TO PULL UBHO.
06:30 -07:45 1.25 WIRELN P SDTRK1 PULL MWD TOOLS WISLICK LINE
07:45 -09:00 1.25 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE TO 8169'
09:00 - 18:00 9.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8169' TO 8200', 3FT/HR

05/07/98 18:00 - 01:00 7.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8200' TO 8222', 3FT/HR
01:00 - 03:30 2.50 CIRC T SDTRK1 LOST 40 BBLS MUD, SPOT LCM PILL

PULL 2 STANDS, REGAINED RETURNS
RUN BACK TO BOTTOM

03:30 - 06:15 2.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8222' TO 8232', 3.5 FT/HR
SEEPAGE LOSSES AT 15 BBLS/HR

06:15 - 10:45 4.50 CIRC T SDTRK1 LOST TOTAL RETURNS AT 8232'
SPOT LCM PILL, REGAIN PARTIAL RETURNS, PULL 10 STANDS, MIX
MUD AND BUILDVOLUME, LET LCM SOAK ON BOTTOM, WORK
PIPE, BROKE CICULATION HAD FULL RETURNS
RUN BACK TO BOTTOM

10:45 - 18:00 7.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8232' TO 8258', 3.5FT/HR
SEEPAGE LOSSES APPROX 10 BBLS/HR

05/08/98 18:00 - 05:30 11.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8258' TO 8300', 3.6FT/HR
05:30 - 07:45 2.25 CIRC T SDTRK1 LOST 45 BBLS MUD, SPOT LCM PILL

PULL 5 STANDS, REGAIN CIRC.
RUN BACK TO BOTTOM

07:45 - 09:15 1.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8300' TO 8309', 6 FT/HR
09:15 - 12:30 3.25 CIRC T SDTRK1 LOSSINGMUDAT 20 + BBLS/HR

SPOT LCM PILL ON BOTTOM

Printed: 05/27/98 1:00:37



AMOCO PRODUCTION Page 10 of 13

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1
Common Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1 Spud Date:
Event Name: REN Start: 04/08/98 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Activity Code Phase Description of Operations

05/08/98 09:15 - 12:30 3.25 CIRC T SDTRK1 PULL 10 STANDS, CIRC. HOLE OFF BOTTOM, BUILD VOLUME
RUN BACK TO BOTTOM

12:30 - 18:00 5.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8309' TO 8346', 6.7 FT/HR
05/09/98 18:00 -06:15 12.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8346' TO 8417', 5.8 FT/HR

06:15 - 07:15 1.00 CIRC T SDTRK1 SPOT LCM PILL ON BOTTOM
WORK PIPE WITH PUMP OFF
LET LCM SOAK ON BOTTOM

07:15 - 18:00 10.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8417' TO 8485', 6.3 FTlHR
05/10/98 18:00 - 19:00 1.00 CIRC T SDTRK1 SPOT LCM PILL ON BOTTOM

WORK PIPE. LET LCM PILL SOAK
19:00 - 20:00 1.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8485' TO 8495', 10 FT/HR
20:00 - 21:00 1.00 CIRC T SDTRK1 SPOT LCM PILL ON BOTTOM

WORK PIPE, LET LCM PILL SOAK
21:00 - 04:30 7.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8495' TO 8534', 5.2 FT/HR
04:30 - 04:45 0.25 CIRC P SDTRK1 SPOT LCM PILL ON BOTTOM
04:45 -06:15 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT TO SHOE
06:15 - 08:30 2.25 WIRELN T SDTRK1 RUN MWD IN ON SLICK LINE

UNABLE TO GET TOOL TO SEAT
08:30 - 10:30 2.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 FINISH TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT
10:30 - 12:00 1.50 RIGSER P SDTRK1 SERVICE RIG AND TOP DRIVE
12:00 - 13:00 1.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 CHANGE OUT BIT AND REAMERS
13:00 - 17:00 4.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE WINEW BIT

MWD IN PLACE FOR SURVEYS
17:00 - 18:00 1.00 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY WITH MWD

05/11/98 18:00 - 18:30 0.50 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY WITH MWD TOOLS
18:30 - 19:30 1.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 PULL BACK INTO WINDOW TO PULL MWD TOOLS
19:30 - 20:30 1.00 WIRELN P SDTRK1 PULL MWD TOOLS WITH SLICK LINE
20:30 - 22:30 2.00 CIRC P SDTRK1 MIX MUD AND BUILDVOLUME
22:30 - 00:00 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP BACK TO BOTTOM
00:00 - 07:30 7.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8534' TO 8560', 3.5 FT/HR
07:30 - 08:30 1.00 CIRC T SDTRK1 SPOT LCM PILL ON BOTTOM

WORK PIPE, LET LCM PILL SOAK
08:30 - 18:00 9.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8560' TO 8588', 3 FT/HR

05/12/98 18:00 - 00:30 6.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8588' TO 8608', 3 FT/HR
00:30 -02:00 1.50 CIRCSM P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP, CALLED TD BASED ON SAMPLES
02:00 -03:30 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TOH TO WINDOW
03:30 -04:30 1.00 WIRELN P SDTRK1 RUN IN MWD TOOLS ON SLICK LINE
04:30 -05:15 0.75 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP BACK TO BOTTOM FOR SURVEY
05:15 - 06:15 1.00 SUR i P SDTRK1 SURVEY WITH MWD TOOLS

92 DEG, 125.6 AZ
06:15 - 07:45 1.50 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE
07:45 - 12:00 4.25 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT OF HOLE
12:00 - 13:30 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 LAY DOWN MWD TOOLS, MONEL COLLARS AND REAMERS
13:30 - 18:00 4.50 TSTBOP P SDTRKi TEST BOP EQUIPMENT

05/13/98 18:00 - 20:00 2.00 TSTBOP P SDTRK1 TEST BOP EQUIPMENT
20:00 -01:00 5.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE WITH BIT
01:00 - 04:00 3.00 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE

NO MUD LOSSES
04:00 - 07:00 3.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT FOR LOGS
07:00 - 10:00 3.00 LOG P SDTRK1 RIG UP SCHLUMBERGER TO RUN LOGGING TOOLS ON DRILL PIPE
10:00 - 18:00 8.00 LOG P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE WITH LOGGING TOOLS

TALLY PIPE GOING IN
05/14/98 18:00 - 00:00 6.00 LOG P SDTRK1 LOG OPEN HOLE WITH SCHLUMBERGER ON DRILL PIPE FROM
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05/08/98 09:15 - 12:30 3.25 CIRC T SDTRK1 PULL 10 STANDS, CIRC. HOLE OFF BOTTOM, BUILD VOLUME
RUN BACK TO BOTTOM

12:30 - 18:00 5.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8309' TO 8346', 6.7 FT/HR
05/09/98 18:00 -06:15 12.25 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8346' TO 8417', 5.8 FT/HR

06:15 - 07:15 1.00 CIRC T SDTRK1 SPOT LCM PILL ON BOTTOM
WORK PIPE WITH PUMP OFF
LET LCM SOAK ON BOTTOM

07:15 - 18:00 10.75 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8417' TO 8485', 6.3 FTlHR
05/10/98 18:00 - 19:00 1.00 CIRC T SDTRK1 SPOT LCM PILL ON BOTTOM

WORK PIPE. LET LCM PILL SOAK
19:00 - 20:00 1.00 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8485' TO 8495', 10 FT/HR
20:00 - 21:00 1.00 CIRC T SDTRK1 SPOT LCM PILL ON BOTTOM

WORK PIPE, LET LCM PILL SOAK
21:00 - 04:30 7.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8495' TO 8534', 5.2 FT/HR
04:30 - 04:45 0.25 CIRC P SDTRK1 SPOT LCM PILL ON BOTTOM
04:45 -06:15 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT TO SHOE
06:15 - 08:30 2.25 WIRELN T SDTRK1 RUN MWD IN ON SLICK LINE

UNABLE TO GET TOOL TO SEAT
08:30 - 10:30 2.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 FINISH TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT
10:30 - 12:00 1.50 RIGSER P SDTRK1 SERVICE RIG AND TOP DRIVE
12:00 - 13:00 1.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 CHANGE OUT BIT AND REAMERS
13:00 - 17:00 4.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE WINEW BIT

MWD IN PLACE FOR SURVEYS
17:00 - 18:00 1.00 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY WITH MWD

05/11/98 18:00 - 18:30 0.50 SUR P SDTRK1 SURVEY WITH MWD TOOLS
18:30 - 19:30 1.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 PULL BACK INTO WINDOW TO PULL MWD TOOLS
19:30 - 20:30 1.00 WIRELN P SDTRK1 PULL MWD TOOLS WITH SLICK LINE
20:30 - 22:30 2.00 CIRC P SDTRK1 MIX MUD AND BUILDVOLUME
22:30 - 00:00 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP BACK TO BOTTOM
00:00 - 07:30 7.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8534' TO 8560', 3.5 FT/HR
07:30 - 08:30 1.00 CIRC T SDTRK1 SPOT LCM PILL ON BOTTOM

WORK PIPE, LET LCM PILL SOAK
08:30 - 18:00 9.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8560' TO 8588', 3 FT/HR

05/12/98 18:00 - 00:30 6.50 DIRW P SDTRK1 DRILL FROM 8588' TO 8608', 3 FT/HR
00:30 -02:00 1.50 CIRCSM P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP, CALLED TD BASED ON SAMPLES
02:00 -03:30 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TOH TO WINDOW
03:30 -04:30 1.00 WIRELN P SDTRK1 RUN IN MWD TOOLS ON SLICK LINE
04:30 -05:15 0.75 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP BACK TO BOTTOM FOR SURVEY
05:15 - 06:15 1.00 SUR i P SDTRK1 SURVEY WITH MWD TOOLS

92 DEG, 125.6 AZ
06:15 - 07:45 1.50 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE
07:45 - 12:00 4.25 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT OF HOLE
12:00 - 13:30 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 LAY DOWN MWD TOOLS, MONEL COLLARS AND REAMERS
13:30 - 18:00 4.50 TSTBOP P SDTRKi TEST BOP EQUIPMENT

05/13/98 18:00 - 20:00 2.00 TSTBOP P SDTRK1 TEST BOP EQUIPMENT
20:00 -01:00 5.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE WITH BIT
01:00 - 04:00 3.00 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE

NO MUD LOSSES
04:00 - 07:00 3.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT FOR LOGS
07:00 - 10:00 3.00 LOG P SDTRK1 RIG UP SCHLUMBERGER TO RUN LOGGING TOOLS ON DRILL PIPE
10:00 - 18:00 8.00 LOG P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE WITH LOGGING TOOLS

TALLY PIPE GOING IN
05/14/98 18:00 - 00:00 6.00 LOG P SDTRK1 LOG OPEN HOLE WITH SCHLUMBERGER ON DRILL PIPE FROM
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Event Name: REN Start: 04/08/98 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Activity Code Phase Description of Operations

05/14/98 18:00 - 00:00 6.00 LOG P SDTRK1 8600' UP TO 5620'
00:00 - 02:00 2.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT WITH LOGGING TOOLS
02:00 - 03:00 1.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 RIG DOWN LOGGING TOOLS
03:00 - 06:00 3.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE WITH BIT
06:00 - 09:00 3.00 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE
09:00 - 11:30 2.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT WITH BIT
11:30 - 18:00 6.50 MISC P SDTRK1 TRIP IN Wl3000' OF DRILL PIPE

PUMP 12 BBLS 15% HCL TO BOTTOM OF DRILL PIPE, REVERSE
ACID OUT
TOH WIDRILL PIPE, TIH TO 3000' WITH THE REST OF THE DRILL
PIPE, PUMP 12 BBLS15% HCL TO THE BOTTOM OF THE DRILL
PIPE, REVERSE OUT
TOH WITH DRILL PIPE
DRILL PIPE SHOULD BE CLEAN

05/15/98 18:00 - 19:00 1.00 MISC P SDTRK1 PICKEL DRILL PIPE WITH 15% HCL
19:00 - 20:30 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT OF HOLE
20:30 - 21:00 0.50 RIGSER P SDTRK1 SERVICE RIG
21:00 - 23:30 2.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE WITH BIT
23:30 - 02:00 2.50 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE
02:00 - 07:30 5.50 CIRC T SDTRK1 STARTED LOSSING MUD AT APPROX 15 BBLS/HR, SPOT LCM PILL

ON BOTTOM, WORK PIPE, SPOT SECOND LCM PILL ON BOTTOM,
WORK PIPE
REGAINED FULL RETURNS
LOST TOTAL OF 50 BBLS

07:30 -09:00 1.50 TUBMOUP SDTRK1 TRIP OUT LAY DOWN 3.5" HEAVY WT.
TRIP OUT TO 5500'

09:00 - 13:30 4.50 MISC P SDTRK1 CLEAN OUT MUD PITS, TRANSFER 2% KCL WATER TO PITS FROM
FRAC TANKS

13:30 - 14:30 1.00 CIRC P SDTRK1 DISPLACE HOLE TO 5500' WITH 2% KCL WATER
14:30 - 16:00 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 FINISH TRIP OUT OF HOLE
16:00 - 18:00 2.00 CSG P SDTRK1 RIG UP CASING CREW

PICK UP AND RUN 4.5" N-80 VAM CASING
05/16/98 18:00 - 21:30 3.50 CSG P SDTRK1 PICK UP AND RUN 89 JTS 4.5" 12.6#

N-80 VAM, ECP, PAC VALVE, LINER HANGER AND PACKER
21:30 - 22:00 0.50 CSG P SDTRK1 RIG DOWN CASING CREW
22:00 -01:30 3.50 CSG P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE WITH LINER

TOP OF LINER @5090'
ECP @7806' TO 7816'
SHOE @7850'

01:30 -03:30 2.00 MISC P SDTRK1 PICK UP CEMENT HEAD, RIG UP DOWELL TEST LINES TO 2000 PSI
03:30 - 10:30 7.00 CIRC T SDTRKi RIG UP TO CIRCULATE, LOST RETURNS(APPROX 100 BBLS)

REGAIN CIRCULATION AFTER LOADING ANNULAS, PUMP 1st PLUG
DID NOT BUMP PLUG, CHECKED DEPTH OF PLUG WITH SLICK LINE,
PLUG HUNG UP IN 4.5" LINER, PUMPED MORE 2% KCL WATER AT
HIGHER RATE TO MOVE PLUG DOWN HOLE, FINALLY BUMPED
PLUG AFTER PUMPING A TOTAL OF 530 BBLS

10:30 - 11:00 0.50 CIRC P SDTRK1 SET PACKER, SET ECP, OPEN PAC VALVE, CIRCULATE PRIOR TO
CEMENT

11:00 - 12:00 1.00 CMTPRI P SDTRK1 CEMENT LINER WITH 465 SKS35/65 POZ, 2% D-20,
.5%

D-112,
.1%

D-153,
.2% D-46, .15%

D-65, HAD GOOD CIRCULATION AND LIFT
PRESSURES
BUMPED PLUG AT 12:00 HRS
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05/14/98 18:00 - 00:00 6.00 LOG P SDTRK1 8600' UP TO 5620'
00:00 - 02:00 2.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT WITH LOGGING TOOLS
02:00 - 03:00 1.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 RIG DOWN LOGGING TOOLS
03:00 - 06:00 3.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE WITH BIT
06:00 - 09:00 3.00 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE
09:00 - 11:30 2.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT WITH BIT
11:30 - 18:00 6.50 MISC P SDTRK1 TRIP IN Wl3000' OF DRILL PIPE

PUMP 12 BBLS 15% HCL TO BOTTOM OF DRILL PIPE, REVERSE
ACID OUT
TOH WIDRILL PIPE, TIH TO 3000' WITH THE REST OF THE DRILL
PIPE, PUMP 12 BBLS15% HCL TO THE BOTTOM OF THE DRILL
PIPE, REVERSE OUT
TOH WITH DRILL PIPE
DRILL PIPE SHOULD BE CLEAN

05/15/98 18:00 - 19:00 1.00 MISC P SDTRK1 PICKEL DRILL PIPE WITH 15% HCL
19:00 - 20:30 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT OF HOLE
20:30 - 21:00 0.50 RIGSER P SDTRK1 SERVICE RIG
21:00 - 23:30 2.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE WITH BIT
23:30 - 02:00 2.50 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE
02:00 - 07:30 5.50 CIRC T SDTRK1 STARTED LOSSING MUD AT APPROX 15 BBLS/HR, SPOT LCM PILL

ON BOTTOM, WORK PIPE, SPOT SECOND LCM PILL ON BOTTOM,
WORK PIPE
REGAINED FULL RETURNS
LOST TOTAL OF 50 BBLS

07:30 -09:00 1.50 TUBMOUP SDTRK1 TRIP OUT LAY DOWN 3.5" HEAVY WT.
TRIP OUT TO 5500'

09:00 - 13:30 4.50 MISC P SDTRK1 CLEAN OUT MUD PITS, TRANSFER 2% KCL WATER TO PITS FROM
FRAC TANKS

13:30 - 14:30 1.00 CIRC P SDTRK1 DISPLACE HOLE TO 5500' WITH 2% KCL WATER
14:30 - 16:00 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 FINISH TRIP OUT OF HOLE
16:00 - 18:00 2.00 CSG P SDTRK1 RIG UP CASING CREW

PICK UP AND RUN 4.5" N-80 VAM CASING
05/16/98 18:00 - 21:30 3.50 CSG P SDTRK1 PICK UP AND RUN 89 JTS 4.5" 12.6#

N-80 VAM, ECP, PAC VALVE, LINER HANGER AND PACKER
21:30 - 22:00 0.50 CSG P SDTRK1 RIG DOWN CASING CREW
22:00 -01:30 3.50 CSG P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE WITH LINER

TOP OF LINER @5090'
ECP @7806' TO 7816'
SHOE @7850'

01:30 -03:30 2.00 MISC P SDTRK1 PICK UP CEMENT HEAD, RIG UP DOWELL TEST LINES TO 2000 PSI
03:30 - 10:30 7.00 CIRC T SDTRKi RIG UP TO CIRCULATE, LOST RETURNS(APPROX 100 BBLS)

REGAIN CIRCULATION AFTER LOADING ANNULAS, PUMP 1st PLUG
DID NOT BUMP PLUG, CHECKED DEPTH OF PLUG WITH SLICK LINE,
PLUG HUNG UP IN 4.5" LINER, PUMPED MORE 2% KCL WATER AT
HIGHER RATE TO MOVE PLUG DOWN HOLE, FINALLY BUMPED
PLUG AFTER PUMPING A TOTAL OF 530 BBLS

10:30 - 11:00 0.50 CIRC P SDTRK1 SET PACKER, SET ECP, OPEN PAC VALVE, CIRCULATE PRIOR TO
CEMENT

11:00 - 12:00 1.00 CMTPRI P SDTRK1 CEMENT LINER WITH 465 SKS35/65 POZ, 2% D-20,
.5%

D-112,
.1%

D-153,
.2% D-46, .15%

D-65, HAD GOOD CIRCULATION AND LIFT
PRESSURES
BUMPED PLUG AT 12:00 HRS

Printed: 05/27/98 1:00:37
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1
Common Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1 Spud Date:
Event Name: REN Start: 04/08/98 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Activity Code Phase Description of Operations

05/16/98 12:00 - 12:30 0.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 PULLED 10 STANDS
12:30 - 13:30 1.00 CIRC P SDTRK1 REVERSE CIRCULATE 46 BBLS

TRACE OF CEMENT TO SURFACE
13:30 - 16:00 2.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT OF THE HOLE
16:00 - 18:00 2.00 WOC P SDTRK1 WIAT ON CEMENT

05/17/98 18:00 - 00:30 6.50 WOC P SDTRK1 WAIT ON CEMENT
00:30 -01:15 0.75 RIGSER P SDTRK1 CUT AND SLIP DRILLING LINE
01:15 -02:15 1.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE WITH BIT
02:15 -08:00 5.75 DRLCMT P SDTRK1 DRILL CEMENT FROM 4432' TO TOP OF LINER AT 5090' (658')
08:00 -09:00 1.00 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN
09:00 -09:15 0.25 TSTCSG P SDTRK1 PRESSURE TEST CASING TO 1500 PSI
09:15 - 10:45 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT WITH BIT
10:45 - 11:45 1.00 TRIP P SDTRK1 PICK UP 3.75" MILL, 1 JT 2.875" TUBING AND CROSS OVER SUB
11:45 - 13:30 1.75 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP IN HOLE WITH 3.75" MILL
13:30 - 15:00 1.50 DRLCMT P SDTRK1 DRILL 36' OF CEMENT INSIDE TOP OF LINER
15:00 - 16:30 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TRIP OUT WITH 3.75" MILL
16:30 - 18:00 1.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 PICK UP POLISH MILL,TRIP IN HOLE TO POLISH LINER TOP FOR

TIE BACK SLEEVE
05/18/98 18:00 - 20:00 2.00 MILL P SDTRK1 POLISH TOP OF LINER WITH POLISH MILLFOR TIEBACK SLEEVE

20:00 - 04:00 8.00 TUBMOUP SDTRK1 RIG UP LAY DOWN TRUCK
TRIP OUT AND LAY DOWN 3.5" DRILL PIPE AND POLISH MILL

04:00 - 10:30 6.50 CSG P SDTRK1 RIG UP CASING CREW AND RUN TIEBACK SLEEVE AND 167 JTS 4.5"
12.6# N-80 VAM CASING TO 5090'
TOP OF LINER

10:30 - 10:45 0.25 TSTCSG P SDTRK1 PRESSURE TEST TIEBACK SLEEVE TO 1500 PSI FOR 15 MIN
10:45 - 12:00 1.25 MISC P SDTRK1 CLEAN PILL TANK FOR PACKER FLUID
12:00 - 13:30 1.50 CIRC P SDTRK1 LOAD ANNULAS WITH 100 BBLS OF PACKER FLUID
13:30 - 17:30 4.00 NDBOP P SDTRK1 NIPPLE DOWN BOP, SET CASING HANGER IN WELL HEAD
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 TSTCSG P SDTRK1 PRESSURE TEST CASING HANGER AND TIEBACK SLEEVE TO 1500

PSI
05/19/98 18:00 - 00:00 6.00 NUBOP P SDTRK1 INSTALL4 1/16" WELL HEAD VALVE

NIPPLE UP BOP ON TOP OF VALVE
00:00 - 01:00 1.00 TSTBOP P SDTRK1 PRESSURE TEST BOP EQUIPMENT
01:00 - 03:00 2.00 RIGMOD P SDTRK1 CHANGE OUT TOOLS TO HANDLE

2 7/8" DRILL PIPE
03:00 - 17:00 14.00 MISC P SDTRK1 WIAT ON 2 7/8" DRILL PIPE

RECIEVED ORDERS TO GO AHEAD AND RELEASE RIG
17:00 - 18:00 1.00 RDRIG P SDTRK1 RIG DOWN ROTARY TOOLS

05/20/98 18:00 -00:00 6.00 RDRIG P SDTRK1 RIG DOWN TOP DRIVE EQUIPMENT
00:00 - 06:00 6.00 RDRIG P SDTRK1 START RIIGING DOWN ROTARY TOOLS

NIPPLE DOWN TO TOP OF ANNULAR
RIG RELEASED AT 06:00 HRS 05/20/98

05/21/98 06:00 - 18:00 RDRIG P SDTRK1 RIGGING DOWN DRILLING RIG.
05/22/98 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 RDRIG P SDTRKi RIGGING DOWN, LOADING OUT.
05/23/98 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 RDRIG P SDTRK1 MOVE OFF DRILLING RIG. DIG FLARE PIT, CLEAN UP LOCATION,

INSTALLANCHORS.
05/24/98 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 MISC P SDTRK1 HAUL IN & UNLOAD 2 7/8"OD DRILLPIPE. HOOK UP CHOKE

MANIFOLD, PRESSURE TEST TO 5000 PSI, OK. RIG UP CAMP
TRAILER. HAUL IN MATTING BOARDS FOR RIG.

05/25/98 06:00 - 17:00 11.00 RURIG P SDTRK1 RIGGING UP.
05/26/98 06:00 -07:00 1.00 MISC P SDTRK1 CREW TRAVEL & SAFETY MEETING.

07:00 - 07:30 0.50 RIGSER P SDTRK1 START EQUIPMENT, WARM ENGINES.
07:30 - 13:00 5.50 TUBMOUP SDTRK1 MEASURE TOOLS & PICK UP 2 7/8"OD DRILLPIPE, TAG CEMENT @

Printed: 05/27/98 1:00:37
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1
Common Well Name: CHAMPLIN 372 C#1 Spud Date:
Event Name: REN Start: 04/08/98 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Activity Code Phase Description of Operations

05/26/98 07:30 - 13:00 5.50 TUBMOVP SDTRK1 5106.29' KB MEASURE.
13:00 - 17:30 4.50 DRLCMÌP SDTRK1 RIG UP SWIVEL, DRILL 93' CEMENT.
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 TRIP P SDTRK1 TIH 4 JOINTS. NO CEMENT.
18:00 - 18:30 0.50 CIRC P SDTRK1 CIRCULATE BOTTOM UP.
18:30 - 19:30 1.00 MISC P SDTRK1 CREW TRAVEL TIME.
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Form8 STATE OF UTAH 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING Fee
WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG 6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

ia. TYPE OF WELL: o
ELL

WAESLL DRY OTHER SIDETRACK 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF COMPLETION:
NEW WORK DEEP- PLUG DIST OTHER 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME
WELL OVER EN BACK RESVR.

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR
- Ch 372 Amoco "C"

9. WELL NO.
Amoco Production Company

- #1 ST #1
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR

10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
P.O. Box 800, Denver, CO 80202

Anschutz Ranch
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location cleatiy and in accordance with any State requiternents)

11. SEC., T , R., M., OR BLOCK AND SURVEY
At surface OR AREA
860' FNL X 536' FWL NWl4 NWl$ Sec.23-T4N-R7E
At top prod. interval reported below
BH=2642' FNL X 2766' FWL NWl4 SE/4

At total depth 14. API NO. DATE ISSUED 12. COUNTY 13. STATE

43-043-30143 Summit UT
15. DATE SPUDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 17. DATE COMPL. og 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, FKB, RT, GR, ETC.) 19. ELEV. CASINGHEAD

04/10/1998 05/13/1998 06/03/1998 e -> 7001'
20. TOTAL DEPTH, MD & TVD 21. PLUG BACK TD, MD & TVD 22. IF MULTIPLECOMPL., 23. INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS

HOW MANY DRILLEDAT
8,608' 6,649' 6152' +
24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION-TOP, BOTTOM, NAME(MD& TVD) 25. WAS DIRECTIONAL

SURVEY MADE
7,849.30' - 8,608'
26. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN 27. WAS WELL CORED YES NO (Submitanalysis)

CNDL GR AIT CL DRILLSTEM TEST YES NO (seereverseside)

28. CASING RECORD (Reportallsttings setin well)
CASING SIZE WEIGHT, LBJFT. DEPTH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT POLLED

9 5/8" 32.3# 1-40 1518' From original hole

7" 23 & 26# 7300.25 From original hole

29. LINER RECORD 30. TUBING RECORD
SIZE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

4 1/2" 5,107' 7849' 465sks35/65poz 4.5" 5090'

4 10,834' 12,266'
3 PEE HRATILONRECOR49 -ai s608and ACID, SHOT, FRAC R CAENMDEKNDSQF TZE lAEL

U ED

JUL 10 1998

3
E y of purnp) WELL STATUS (Producing or

06/17/1998 Flowing
shut-in) Producing

DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SIZE PROD'N FOR OIL-BBL GAS--MCF WATER--BBL GAS-OIL RATIO
TEST PERIOD I

06/03/1998 7 38/64 4 0 |15.352MCF 0
FLOW, TUBING CASING CALCULATED OIL-BBL GAS-MCF WATER-BBL OIL GRAVITY--API (CORR.)
PRESSURE 24-HOUR RATE

1750 0 + 0 15.352 MCF 0
34. DISPOSITION OF GAS (sold, usedforfuel, vented, etc.) TEST WITNESSED BY

SOLD
35 LIST OF ATTACHMENTS

Deviation Summary, Wellbore Diagram
36. I hereby certify that e foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records

13. Signature: . . Title: Permit Agent Date: 07/08/1919
(3/89) See Spaces for Additional Data on Reverse
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DRILLED FOOTAGE CALCULATION FOR
DIRECTIONAL AND HORIZONTAL WELLS

Unit, Well Name: Anchutz Ranch, Champlain 372 Amoco C, #1 ST #1

Operator: Amoco Production Company
API Well #: 43-043-30143

Well Completion: Horizontal, Producer, 1 Lateral

First leg description: Lateral #1
Kick Off Point MD 5600.00

End of Leg MD 8608.00
Footage drilled: 3008.00

Max. TVD Recorded 6671.56

ITotal Footage Drilled (MD): 3008.00
Deepest point (TVD):

DRILLED FOOTAGE CALCULATION FOR
DIRECTIONAL AND HORIZONTAL WELLS

Unit, Well Name: Anchutz Ranch, Champlain 372 Amoco C, #1 ST #1

Operator: Amoco Production Company
API Well #: 43-043-30143

Well Completion: Horizontal, Producer, 1 Lateral

First leg description: Lateral #1
Kick Off Point MD 5600.00

End of Leg MD 8608.00
Footage drilled: 3008.00

Max. TVD Recorded 6671.56

ITotal Footage Drilled (MD): 3008.00
Deepest point (TVD):



Anadrill

Champlin 372 C-1 ST #l
Summit County, Utah

CERTIFIED SURVEY DATA

MD INC AZ TVD LAT DEP VS DLS
Feet Deg Deg Feet N/S E/W Feet Deg

Tie in 21.08 126.53 -272.56 351.82 444.93
5634.00 23.20 126.50 5544.79 -280.18 362.12 457.73 6.24
5665.00 25.00 126.00 5573.09 -287.67 372.33 470.38 5.84
5696.00 25.10 127.70 5601.17 -295.54 382.83 483.49 2.34
5727.00 27.15 130.00 5629.00 -304.11 393.45 497.14 7.37
5758.00 28.09 123.70 5656.48 -312.70 404.94 511.48 9.89
5790.00 28.17 124.20 5684.70 -321.13 417.46 526.51 0.78
5822.00 28.90 122.70 5712.81 -329.55 430.21 541.72 3.20
5853.00 29.92 121.30 5739.82 -337.62 443.12 556.83 3.97
5885.00 32.40 122.60 5767.20 -346.38 457.17 573.26 8.03
5916.00 33.70 123.40 5793.18 -355.59 471.34 590.07 4.42
5948.00 34.89 124.90 5819.62 -365.72 486.26 608.03 4.56
5979.00 36.00 125.50 5844.87 -376.08 500.95 625.97 3.75
6011.00 37.50 126.50 5870.51 -387.34 516.44 645.09 5.05
6042.00 39.00 125.50 5894.86 -398.61 531.97 664.25 5.23
6074.00 40.90 123.40 5919.39 -410.23 548.91 684.73 7.28
6105.00 42.40 120.60 5942.55 -421.14 566.38 705.17 7.71
6136.00 43.10 119.20 5965.32 -431.63 584.62 725.94 3.81
6167.00 44.90 117.80 5987.62 -441.90 603.55 747.11 6.60
6199.00 46.60 118.50 6009.94 -452.71 623.76 769.62 5.54
6231.00 49.00 120.60 6031.44 -464.41 644.37 792.99 8.94
6263.00 51.50 120.60 6051.90 -476.93 665.55 817.33 7.81
6294.00 53.60 120.60 6070.75 -489.46 686.73 841.67 6.77
6326.00 56.30 120.60 6089.12 -502.79 709.28 867.58 8.44
6358.00 58.80 120.60 6106.29 -516.54 732.52 894.29 7.81
6389.00 60.20 120.60 6122.03 -530.13 755.51 920.71 4.52
6420.00 59.10 121.30 6137.69 -543.89 778.45 947.19 4.05
6451.00 57.50 122.00 6153.98 -557.73 800.90 973.35 5.51
6482.00 58.30 123.40 6170.45 -571.92 823.00 999.44 4.61
6514.00 61.21 123.80 6186.57 -587.21 846.02 1026.96 9.16
6546.00 63.10 122.70 6201.52 -602.72 869.68 1055.11 6.64
6577.00 63.90 123.80 6215.35 -617.94 892.88 1082.71 4.09
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6635.00 64.20 125.50 6240.57 -647.14 936.18 1134.73 7.05
6666.00 63.10 125.50 6254.33 -663.27 958.80 1162.45 3.55
6698.00 62.60 125.50 6268.94 -679.80 981.98 1190.87 1.56

Amoco Production Company
Champlin 372 C-1 ST #1
Completed Survey Results

Anadrill

Champlin 372 C-1 ST #l
Summit County, Utah

CERTIFIED SURVEY DATA

MD INC AZ TVD LAT DEP VS DLS
Feet Deg Deg Feet N/S E/W Feet Deg
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Anadrill

Champlin 372 C-1 ST #l
Summit County, Utah

CERTIFIED SURVEY DATA

MD INC AZ TVD LAT DEP VS DLS
Feet Deg Deg Feet N/S E/W Feet Deg

6729.00 62.40 125.50 6283.25 -695.77 1004.36 1218.32 0.65
6761.00 62.10 126.30 6298.15 -712.37 1027.30 1246.60 2.40
6792.00 62.20 126.20 6312.63 -728.58 1049.41 1273.97 0.43
6824.00 62.80 126.30 6327.41 -745.37 1072.30 1302.32 1.90
6855.00 63.05 125.00 6341.52 -761.45 1094.73 1329.88 3.82
6887.00 63.20 124.80 6355.98 -777.78 1118.14 1358.34 0.73
6918.00 62.60 124.80 6370.11 -793.53 1140.80 1385.87 1.94
6949.00 61.30 124.10 6384.68 -809.01 1163.36 1413.13 4.64
6980.00 60.20 124.10 6399.83 -824.17 1185.75 1440.08 3.55
7012.00 60.88 124.40 6415.57 -839.86 1208.78 1467.85 2.28
7041.00 61.00 124.10 6429.65 -854.12 1229.74 1493.11 0.99
7073.00 62.10 123.40 6444.90 -869.75 1253.13 1521.12 3.94
7104.00 64.00 123.40 6458.95 -884.96 1276.20 1548.62 6.13
7136.00 63.50 122.70 6473.10 -900.62 1300.26 1577.16 2.51
7167.00 62.70 123.40 6487.13 -915.69 1323.43 1604.65 3.27
7199.00 61.60 123.40 6502.08 -931.27 1347.05 1632.81 3.44
7229.00 62.00 123.40 6516.25 -945.82 1369.12 1659.12 1.33
7261.00 62.90 123.70 6531.05 -961.50 1392.77 1687.36 2.93
7292.00 64.40 124.10 6544.81 -976.99 1415.82 1715.03 4.97
7323.00 66.80 125.30 6557.62 -993.07 1439.03 1743.17 8.SI
7354.00 69.70 126.20 6569.10 -1009.89 1462.39 1771.92 9.74
7385.00 73.12 125.90 6578.98 -1027.18 1486.14 1801.25 11.07
7417.00 75.30 124.80 6587.69 -1044.99 1511.26 1831.98 7.57
7444.00 77.40 125.50 6594.06 -1060.09 1532.71 1858.16 8.18
7475.00 78.30 124.10 6600.59 -1077.39 1557.60 1888.38 5.28
7507.00 78.61 125.00 6606.99 -1095.17 1583.42 1919.63 2.92
7538.00 78.90 124.80 6613.04 -1112.57 1608.35 1949.96 1.13
7569.00 79.00 124.10 6618.98 -1129.78 1633.44 1980.28 2.24
7600.00 79.72 124.10 6624.70 -1146.86 1658.67 2010.64 2.32
7631.00 80.20 122.70 6630.11 -1163.66 1684.16 2041.01 4.71
7662.00 80.80 122.60 6635.22 -1180.16 1709.90 2071.40 1.96
7694.00 80.75 122.40 6640.35 -1197.13 1736.54 2102.78 0.64
7726.00 80.20 122.70 6645.65 -1214.11 1763.14 2134.13 I.95
7757.00 80.30 122.70 6650.90 -1230.61 1788.85 2164.50 0.32
7788.00 81.80 123.40 6655.72 -1247.31 1814.52 2194.95 5.33
7893.00 85.46 122.50 6667.37 -1304.06 1902.07 2298.69 3.59
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Anadrill

Champlin 372 C-1 ST #l
Summit County, Utah

CERTIFIED SURVEY DATA

MD INC AZ TVD LAT DEP VS DLS
Feet Deg Deg Feet N/S E/W Feet Deg

8012.00 90.50 122.80 6671.56 -1368.20 2002.17 2416.84 4.24
8075.00 92.10 124.40 .13 -1403.05 2054.63 2479.54 3.59
8124.00 91.89 125.60 6668.43 -1431.14 2094.74 2528.38 2.48
8230.00 92.40 126.30 6664.46 -1493.32 2180.49 2634.15 0.82
8325.00 92.50 126.70 6660.40 -1549.78 2256.79 2728.97 0.43
8421.00 92.70 127.90 6656.04 -1607.89 2333.07 2824.83 1.27
8489.00 93.10 128.80 6652.60 -1650.03 2386.33 2892.73 1.45
8562.00 92.00 125.60 6649.36 -1694.12 2444.41 2965.61 4.63

Proj. 8 91.08 123.76 6648.12 -1720.28 2482.22 3011.46 4.47

Vertical Section Calculated on a Azimuth of 129.05 Degrees
Vertical Section Relative to WellIread

Minimum Curvature Calculation Method
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SIDETRACK WELLBORE DIAGRAM
Ooen Hole Nuaaet ComDIetlon Field: Anschutz Ranch

Well: Champlin 372 "C" 1 ST #1
SEC: 23 BWP: 4N RGE: 7E

KB Correction: 22.50'

- Descrption of tools run Etc. TMD depth KB

1 jt of 4.5" 12.60# N-80vam tbg (29.51') 22.50'

Tbg Pup: 4.5" 12.60# N-80vam tbg pup (2.22') 52.01'

9 5/8" 32.3# H-40 ST & C csg set at 1518'

-----167 jts of 4.5 12.60# N-80Vam tbg (4990.38') 54.23'

Cement top 7" per CBL on 2/15/98 at 4906'
Logged by Schlumberger

----HES "R"nipplewi3.813" profile (2.00') 5044.61'

7" Casinq Data: -1 jtof 4.5" 12.60# N-80vam tbg (33.35') 5046.61'

7" 26# K-55 ST&C stub frm 16.70' to 29.36 Baker tie back sleeve 5079.96'
7"23# K-55 ST&C casing frm 29.36' to 5003.63· Baker "ZXP" packer & HYFLO 2 hydraulic liner hanger 5090'
7" 26# S-95 & K-55 casing frm 5003.63' to 7300.25'

window cut in 7" casing from 5614' to 5624'

Deviation Record:

Depth: Incin Angle DL I 100 4.5" 12.60# N-80 Vam casing liner frm 5107.49' to 7849 .30'

5758' 28.1 9.86
6074' 40.9 7.28
6231' 49 8.94
6389' 60.2 4.52 Baker Pressure ActivatedCementer 7772.83'
6451' 57.5 5.51
6608' 64.4 1.99
6761' 62.1 2.4 Baker "XL-10CR" Extemal Casing Packer 7799.75'
6918' 62.6 1.94
7073' 62.1 3.94
7229' 62 1.33
7385' 73.1 11.01 4.5" 12.6# N-80 Vam casing liner shoe
7538' 78.9 1.16 End of liner shoe at 7849.30'
7662 80.8 1.96
7893' 85.5 3.63
8325' 92.5 0.43
8562' 92 4.63 OPEN HOLE: 6.125" hole size from7849.30' to 8608'

ECEWE i
PBTD: 8608' NOTE:plug back tagged at 8614' per completion

SEP 23 1998 TMD: 8608'
workstring pipe tally - 6' deeper than drilling.

CIV.0FOIL,GAS&
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BP Amoco '

FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION

To· From:
State of Utah
Department of Natural Resources Craig Wiggs
Division of Oil,Gas and Mining BP Amoco Exploration
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210 Western U.S. Gas Business Unit
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801 P.O. Box3092

Houston, Texas 77253-3092
Attn: Mr. Robert J. Krueger

Telephone: 281-366-5486
Reply Fax: 281-366-7937

.

Fax No.: 801-359-3940
Date: June 14, 1999 No. of Pages

Including Cover: 3

DIV.0F0!L,GAS&IMNG
This communicationis intended for the use of the party to which it is addressed and may contain information that is privileged or confidentialunder applicable law. If you are not
the intended recipient,you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copyingof this communicationis not permitted. If you have received this communicationin
error, please notifyus immediately and then destroy this communication.Thank you.
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Craig L. Wiggs
ARE/Painter Resource Manager
Western U.S. Gas Business Unit

BPA BP Amoco Exploration/TIOCO 501 WestLake Park Boulevard
Houston, Texas 77079
Telephone: (281) 366-5486
Facsimile: (281) 366-7937

JSuneeo4 9a

Department of Natural Resources
Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
PO Box 145801
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Attn: Mr. Robert J. Krueger

Re: Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned Wells Compliance Review

Dear Sir,

BP Amoco is in receipt of your letter dated February 23, 1999 concerning 4 shut-in or
temporarily abandoned wells in the state of Utah. Apparently this letter was lost during
the closure of our Denver office and the move to Houston. I apologize for the late reply.
A short summary of the status of each well follows:

Island Ranching Well Dl (API #43-043-30161): This well was drilled in 1982 and
discovered to have relatively low volumes of sour gas. BP Amoco have been holding
the well to see if adequate volumes of sour gas can be found in the area to justify
installation of a sour gas pipeline to a sour gas plant. Anschutz Corporation have been
actively exploring in the area, and BP Amoco have recently farmed out acreage in the
vicinity of this well to the Anschutz Corporation. BP Amoco are investigating the
timing of any recent wellbore integrity tests and will submit the necessary Sundry
Notice as required to ensure compliance for this wellbore.

Champlin 458 (API #43-043-30130): This well appears to have been permanently or
temporarily abandoned. BP Amoco are investigating our files and will ensure the
proper paperwork has been completed to abandon this well.
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Mr. Robert J. Krueger
State of Utah - Department of Natural Resources
Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
Page two -

Champlin 372 Cl (API #43-043-30143): This well was sidetracked in 1998, and has
been producing recently into the Questarpipeline system. The well does produce with a
relatively high nitrogen content, and is periodically shut-in due to pipeline constraints.
BP Amoco plan to route this well into the Anschutz Ranch East NGL/NRU Plant in
1999 to remove the nitrogen and produce the well on a continuous basis.

TPC State 23-36-14-24 (API #43-047-32593): This well was sold by Amoco, and it is
currently owned and operated by Ratomco in Billings, MT.

Given our recent move to Houston, Texas and the merger of BP and Amoco, we have a
number of new personnel and filing systems. Once all details are determined
concerning the Island Ranching D1 and Champlin 458 wells, proper sundries will be
forwarded to your office.

If you have any further questions or comments concerning these wells, please contact
me at 281-366-5486 in Houston.

Sincerel

Crai L. Wiggs

Mr. Robert J. Krueger
State of Utah - Department of Natural Resources
Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
Page two -
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October26, 1998

43 43 30 /43
Division ofOil, Gas andMiníng
1594WestNorth Temple, Suite1210
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Attn: Carol Daniels

Footage's Champlín 372 AmocoC1 ST1

This letter is to confirmthat the footageshouldbe 860' FNL x 536' FWL The reasonfor the change is

back in 1980 when the well was completedthe sectian lines and cornerstoneswere not found. Then in

1981Amoco hiredUiuta Engineeringto go I andresurvey the fieldto got everything in the right and

proper perspectiveso when we went back into the wellborewewereon the propersection lines and

cornerstoneswhichled as to the new footage's.

If you have anyquestionsyou maycall Clark Lawlerat (307) 783-2406with Amoco.

S care

Gigi Martinez
Amoco ProductionCompany

Post-it' Fax Note 7671 at*g
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Craig L. Wiggs
ARE/Painter Resource Manager
Western U.S. Gas Business Unit

BPA BP Amoco Explorationl77OCO 501 WestLake Park Boulevard
Houston, Texas 77079
Telephone: (281) 366-5486
Facsimile: (281) 366-7937

43, 043. 3D L43
June 14, 19ah

Department of Natural Resources
Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
PO Box 145801
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Attn: Mr. Robert J. Krueger

Re: Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned Wells Compliance Review

Dear Sir,

BP Amoco is in receipt of your letter dated February 23, 1999 concerning 4 shut-in or
temporarily abandoned wells in the state of Utah. Apparently this letter was lost during
the closure of our Denver office and the move to Houston. I apologize for the late reply.
A short summary of the status of each well follows:

Island Ranching Well Dl (API #43-043-30161): This well was drilled in 1982 and
discovered to have relatively low volumes of sour gas. BP Amoco have been holding
the well to see if adequate volumes of sour gas can be found in the area to justify
installation of a sour gas pipeline to a sour gas plant. Anschutz Corporation have been
actively exploring in the area, and BP Amoco have recently farmed out acreage in the
vicinity of this well to the Anschutz Corporation. BP Amoco are investigating the
timing of any recent wellbore integrity tests and will submit the necessary Sundry
Notice as required to ensure compliance for this wellbore.

Champlin 458 (API #43-043-30130): This well appears to have been permanently or
temporarily abandoned. BP Amoco are investigating our files and will ensure the
proper paperwork has been completed to abandon this well.
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Mr. Robert J. Krueger
State of Utah - Department of Natural Resources
Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
Page two -

Champlin 372 Cl (API #43-043-30143): This well was sidetracked in 1998, and has
been producing recently into the Questarpipeline system. The well does produce with a
relatively high nitrogen content, and is periodically shut-in due to pipeline constraints.
BP Amoco plan to route this well into the Anschutz Ranch East NGL/NRU Plant in
1999 to remove the nitrogen and produce the well on a continuous basis.

TPC State 23-36-14-24 (API #43-047-32593): This well was sold by Amoco, and it is
currently owned and operated by Ratomco in Billings, MT.

Given our recent move to Houston, Texas and the merger of BP and Amoco, we have a
number of new personnel and filing systems. Once all details are determined
concerning the Island Ranching Dl and Champlin 458 wells, proper sundries will be
forwarded to your office.

If you have any further questions or comments concerning these wells, please contact
me at 281-366-5486 in Houston.

Sincerel

Craig L. Wiggs

Mr. Robert J. Krueger
State of Utah - Department of Natural Resources
Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
Page two -
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNAT10NANDSERIALNUMBER

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do not use this form for proposals to drig new wells, significandy deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to See Attacheddrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLfann for such proposats.
1. TYPE OF WELL

OIL WELL O GAS WELL O OTHER See Attached 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER

See Attached
1 NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER

Amoco Production Company Attached
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELDANDPOOLOR WILDCAT:
501 Westlake Park Blvgg, Houston STATE TX ziP77079 (281) 366-5328 See Attached

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: See Attached COUNTY: See Attached

OTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ÆTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPMR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CM TUUNG PLUG ANDMDON VENT OR FIARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME O PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: OperatOr Name

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Uhange

12- DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Amoco Production Company proposes to change its name to BP America Production Company, effective December 31, 2001.
Mailingaddresses and designated agents shall remain the same.

Attached to this sundry is a listing of wells currently operated by Amoco Production Company. This list includes all wells with
the exception of those wells which have a plugged or D&A status.

Also attached for the Board's file is a copy of the Board Resolution approving the name change.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Alan Woog TITLE Regulatory Engineer

SIGNATURE DATE 12/11/2001

(This space for State use only)

DEC13 2001
DIVISIONOFw2ooo> (s•••• -•'·••kl•) OIL, GAS AND

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNAT10NANDSERIALNUMBER

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do not use this form for proposals to drig new wells, significandy deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to See Attacheddrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLfann for such proposats.
1. TYPE OF WELL

OIL WELL O GAS WELL O OTHER See Attached 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER

See Attached
1 NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER

Amoco Production Company Attached
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELDANDPOOLOR WILDCAT:
501 Westlake Park Blvgg, Houston STATE TX ziP77079 (281) 366-5328 See Attached

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: See Attached COUNTY: See Attached

OTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ÆTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPMR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CM TUUNG PLUG ANDMDON VENT OR FIARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME O PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: OperatOr Name

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Uhange

12- DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Amoco Production Company proposes to change its name to BP America Production Company, effective December 31, 2001.
Mailingaddresses and designated agents shall remain the same.

Attached to this sundry is a listing of wells currently operated by Amoco Production Company. This list includes all wells with
the exception of those wells which have a plugged or D&A status.

Also attached for the Board's file is a copy of the Board Resolution approving the name change.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Alan Woog TITLE Regulatory Engineer

SIGNATURE DATE 12/11/2001

(This space for State use only)

DEC13 2001
DIVISIONOFw2ooo> (s•••• -•'·••kl•) OIL, GAS AND



UNITEDSTATES OF AMERICA §
STATE OF TEXAS §
COUNTY OF HARRIS §
CITY OF HOUSTON §

CERTIFICATE

M. S. Haskins,of lawful age, first being duly sworn on oath, deposes and says:

1. That she is the duly elected, qualified and acting Assistant Secretary of

Amoco Production Company, a corporationorganized and existing under the laws of the

State of Delaware, U.S.A.;

2. That on November 12, 2001, by consent action of the Board of Directors of

Amoco Production Company (hereinafter referred to as "Company"), the following

resolutions were adopted:

WHEREAS, in connection with BP America Inc.'s ("BP") integration of
Atlantic Richfield Company ("ARCO")and Vastar Resources, Inc. ("Vastar"),
BP has elected to reorganize, consolidate and merge its upstream onshore
Lower48 assets into a single legal entity to align BP's legal structure with
its business organizationand to improve operating efficiencies;and

WHEREAS, BP desires Amoco Production Company ("Company")to be
such single legal entity for the purposes of such reorganization,
consolidation and merger; and

WHEREAS such reorganization, consolidation and merger shall be
accomplished by December 31, 2001 pursuant to a Reorganization
Agreement (Agreement") by and between ARCO and BP Company North
America Inc. (BP Company NA"),the parent of Company, resulting in
ARCO's upstream onshore Lower48 assets being transferredto Company
and Vastar being merged into Company; and

WHEREAS,pursuant to such Agreement, asset, stock and liabilitytransfers
will occur in consideration for Class B common stock of BP Company NA
and Company's agreement to assume all obligationsand indemnifyARCO
for all past and future liabilities relatingto such transfers;and

WHEREAS, in connection with such reorganizatlon, Company desires to
change its name to BP America Production Company, effective December
31, 2001 with corporate seal as follows;
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WHEREAS all officersand directors of Company wll!remaln unchanged.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT,

RESOLVED, Company will accept asset, stock and liability transfers
effectiveDecember 31, 2001 pursuant to theAgreement and willassume all
obligations and indemnifyARCO for all past or future liabilitiesrelating to
such transfers.

FURTHER RESOLVED, Company will change its name and corporate seal
to BP America Production Company, effective December 31, 2001 and all
officersand directors willremain unchanged.

3. That the aforesaid resolutions have not been amended, rescinded, or

annulled,but remain infullforce and effecton the date hereof.

EXECUTEDin the City of Houston, State of Texas, on this the i day of

SUBSC D and sworn to before me this day of , 2001.

(Notary Seal)

DENISEROBERTSON
NouryPubuc,Staceofa NOTARY PUBLIC,STATE OF TEXAS

My CommissionExpige,
October 12,
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Amoco Production Company Name Change

API Well Number Operator Well Name Well Type Well Status Field Name Sec Twp-Rng
43-043-30096-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W16-14 Gas Well Shut In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 16 4N-8E
43-043-30106-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 34-2 SWD Active Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 34 4N-7E
43-043-30123-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W20-08 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 20 4N-8E
43-043-30129-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE 29-04ST1 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 29 4N-8E
43-043-30130-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST E21-14 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 21 4N-8E
43-043-30135-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W21-04 Gas Well Shut In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 21 4N-8E
43-043-30136-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W29-02 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 29 4N-8E
43-043-30138-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W16-06 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 16 4N-8E
43-043-30139-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ISLAND RANCHING C-1 SWD Active Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 26 4N-7E
43-043-30143-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 23 4N-7E
43-043-30145-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W20-14 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 20 4N-8E
43-043-30148-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W20-16 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 20 4N-8E
43-043-30154-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W29-12 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 29 4N-8E
43-043-30156-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W30-16 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 30 4N-8E
43-043-30157-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W36-16 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 36 4N-7E
43-043-30159-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W20-06 Gas Well Shut In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 20 4N-8E
43-043-30161-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ISLAND RANCHING D-1 Gas Well Shut_In WEBER FORMATION 14 4N-7E
43-043-30162-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W32-04 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 32 4N-8E
43-043-30164-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W31-08 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 31 4N-8E
43-043-30165-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W31-04 E Gas Well Shut In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 31 4N-8E
43-043-30167-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W36-08 Gas Well Prodicing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 36 4N-7E
43-043-30168-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO CHAMPLIN 387 B1A Gas Well Shut In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 9 3N-7E
43-043-30170-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO CHAMPLIN 372 D-1 Gas Well Prodicing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 23 4N-7E
43-043-30176-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W17-16 Gas Well Shut In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 17 4N-8E
43-043-30183-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W30-08 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 30 4N-8E
43-043-30185-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W30-14 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 30 4N-8E
43-043-30188-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W01-06 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 1 3N-7E
43-043-30190-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W31-12 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 31 4N-8E
43-043-30204-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W19-16 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 19 4N-8E
43-043-30209-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W1-02 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 1 3N-7E
43-043-30215-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W30-10 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 30 4N-8E
43-043-30216-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W30-15 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 30 4N-8E
43-043-30217-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W31-06 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 31 4N-8E
43-043-30218-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W30-02 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 30 4N-8E
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Amoco Production Company Name Change
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43-043-30096-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W16-14 Gas Well Shut In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 16 4N-8E
43-043-30106-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 34-2 SWD Active Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 34 4N-7E
43-043-30123-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W20-08 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 20 4N-8E
43-043-30129-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE 29-04ST1 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 29 4N-8E
43-043-30130-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST E21-14 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 21 4N-8E
43-043-30135-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W21-04 Gas Well Shut In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 21 4N-8E
43-043-30136-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W29-02 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 29 4N-8E
43-043-30138-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W16-06 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 16 4N-8E
43-043-30139-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ISLAND RANCHING C-1 SWD Active Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 26 4N-7E
43-043-30143-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 23 4N-7E
43-043-30145-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W20-14 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 20 4N-8E
43-043-30148-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W20-16 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 20 4N-8E
43-043-30154-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W29-12 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 29 4N-8E
43-043-30156-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W30-16 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 30 4N-8E
43-043-30157-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W36-16 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 36 4N-7E
43-043-30159-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W20-06 Gas Well Shut In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 20 4N-8E
43-043-30161-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ISLAND RANCHING D-1 Gas Well Shut_In WEBER FORMATION 14 4N-7E
43-043-30162-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W32-04 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 32 4N-8E
43-043-30164-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W31-08 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 31 4N-8E
43-043-30165-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W31-04 E Gas Well Shut In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 31 4N-8E
43-043-30167-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W36-08 Gas Well Prodicing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 36 4N-7E
43-043-30168-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO CHAMPLIN 387 B1A Gas Well Shut In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 9 3N-7E
43-043-30170-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO CHAMPLIN 372 D-1 Gas Well Prodicing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 23 4N-7E
43-043-30176-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W17-16 Gas Well Shut In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 17 4N-8E
43-043-30183-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W30-08 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 30 4N-8E
43-043-30185-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W30-14 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 30 4N-8E
43-043-30188-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W01-06 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 1 3N-7E
43-043-30190-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W31-12 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 31 4N-8E
43-043-30204-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W19-16 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 19 4N-8E
43-043-30209-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W1-02 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 1 3N-7E
43-043-30215-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W30-10 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 30 4N-8E
43-043-30216-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W30-15 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 30 4N-8E
43-043-30217-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W31-06 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 31 4N-8E
43-043-30218-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE W30-02 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 30 4N-8E
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API Well Number Operator Well Name Well Type Well Status Field Name Sec Twp-Rng
43-043-30220-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W20-12 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 20 4N-8E
43-043-30226-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE E28-06 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 28 4N-8E
43-043-30227-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W36-10 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 36 4N-7E
43-043-30228-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTIONCO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W20-02 Gas Well Shut In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 20 4N-8E
43-043-30229-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W20-10 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 20 4N-8E
43-043-30231-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W16-12 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 16 4N-8E
43-043-30238-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W20-04 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 20 4N-8E
43-043-30248-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W30-12A GIW Active Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 30 4N-8E
43-043-30250-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W29-06A Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 29 4N-8E
43-043-30251-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W29-14A Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 29 4N-8E
43-043-30255-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W36-14 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 36 4N-7E
43-043-30257-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST E28-12 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 28 4N-8E
43-043-30265-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W2-10 GIW Active Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 2 3N-7E
43-043-30270-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST WO1-04 Gas Well Shut In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 1 3N-7E
43-043-30271-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST WO1-12 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 1 3N-7E
43-043-30272-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W19-08 GIW Active Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 19 4N-8E
43-043-30273-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W30-06 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 30 4N-8E
43-043-30277-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W11-1 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 11 3N-7E
43-043-30279-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W30-13 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 25 4N-7E
43-043-30280-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTIONCO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W31-05 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 31 4N-8E
43-043-30283-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W12-04 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 2 3N-7E
43-043-30286-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W20-09 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 20 4N-8E
43-043-30291-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W20-03 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 20 4N-8E
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43-043-30220-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W20-12 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 20 4N-8E
43-043-30226-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ARE E28-06 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 28 4N-8E
43-043-30227-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W36-10 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 36 4N-7E
43-043-30228-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTIONCO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W20-02 Gas Well Shut In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 20 4N-8E
43-043-30229-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W20-10 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 20 4N-8E
43-043-30231-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W16-12 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 16 4N-8E
43-043-30238-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W20-04 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 20 4N-8E
43-043-30248-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W30-12A GIW Active Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 30 4N-8E
43-043-30250-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W29-06A Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 29 4N-8E
43-043-30251-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W29-14A Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 29 4N-8E
43-043-30255-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W36-14 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 36 4N-7E
43-043-30257-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST E28-12 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 28 4N-8E
43-043-30265-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W2-10 GIW Active Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 2 3N-7E
43-043-30270-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST WO1-04 Gas Well Shut In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 1 3N-7E
43-043-30271-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST WO1-12 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 1 3N-7E
43-043-30272-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W19-08 GIW Active Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 19 4N-8E
43-043-30273-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W30-06 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 30 4N-8E
43-043-30277-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W11-1 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 11 3N-7E
43-043-30279-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W30-13 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 25 4N-7E
43-043-30280-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTIONCO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W31-05 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 31 4N-8E
43-043-30283-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W12-04 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 2 3N-7E
43-043-30286-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W20-09 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 20 4N-8E
43-043-30291-00-00 AMOCO PRODUCTION CO ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST W20-03 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST 20 4N-8E
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Qivisionof Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH 4-KAS
2. CDW·--- 5-LP
3. JLT 6-FILE

Enter date after each listed item is completed

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent

X Operator Name Change Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 12-31-2001

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
AMOCO PRODUCTION COMPANY BP AMERICA PRODUCTION COMPANY
Address: 501 WESTLAKE PARK BLVD Address: 501 WESTLAKE PARK BLVD

HOUSTON, TX 77079 HOUSTON,TX 77079
Phone: 1-(281)-366-5328 Phone: 1-(281)-366-5328

Account NOO50 Account N1990

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)

API ENTITY SEC. TWN LEASE WELL WELL
NAME NO. NO. RNG TYPE TYPE STATUS
CHAMPLIN 387 B1A 43-043-30168 1404 09-3N-7E FEE GW S
ISLAND RANCH D-1 43-043-30161 1380 14-4N-7E FEE GW S
CHAMPLIN 372 D-1 43-043-30170 1405 23-4N-7E FEE GW P
CHAMPLIN 372 D-1 43-043-30170 10957 23-4N-7E FEE GW P
ÓHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1 SDTRK 1 43-043-30143 1395 23-4N-8E FEE GW P
CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1 SDTRK 1 43-043-30143 10955 23-4N-8E FEE GW P

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 12/13/2001

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 12/13/2001

3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on:

Qivisionof Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH 4-KAS
2. CDW·--- 5-LP
3. JLT 6-FILE

Enter date after each listed item is completed

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent

X Operator Name Change Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 12-31-2001

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
AMOCO PRODUCTION COMPANY BP AMERICA PRODUCTION COMPANY
Address: 501 WESTLAKE PARK BLVD Address: 501 WESTLAKE PARK BLVD

HOUSTON, TX 77079 HOUSTON,TX 77079
Phone: 1-(281)-366-5328 Phone: 1-(281)-366-5328

Account NOO50 Account N1990

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)

API ENTITY SEC. TWN LEASE WELL WELL
NAME NO. NO. RNG TYPE TYPE STATUS
CHAMPLIN 387 B1A 43-043-30168 1404 09-3N-7E FEE GW S
ISLAND RANCH D-1 43-043-30161 1380 14-4N-7E FEE GW S
CHAMPLIN 372 D-1 43-043-30170 1405 23-4N-7E FEE GW P
CHAMPLIN 372 D-1 43-043-30170 10957 23-4N-7E FEE GW P
ÓHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1 SDTRK 1 43-043-30143 1395 23-4N-8E FEE GW P
CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1 SDTRK 1 43-043-30143 10955 23-4N-8E FEE GW P

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 12/13/2001

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 12/13/2001

3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on:



4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: PENDING

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on: N/A

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change) for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: N/A

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator
for wells listed on: N/A

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,
for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 12/18/2001

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 12/14/2001

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 12/14/2001

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 12/11/2001

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 12/18/2001

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

INDIAN BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEDERAL BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed has furnished a bond: 103172911249

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 12/19/2001

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: PENDING

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on: N/A

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change) for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: N/A

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator
for wells listed on: N/A

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,
for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 12/18/2001

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 12/14/2001

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 12/14/2001

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 12/11/2001

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 12/18/2001

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

INDIAN BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEDERAL BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed has furnished a bond: 103172911249

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 12/19/2001



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH 4-KAS

2. CDW v' 5-LP
3. JLT 6-FILE

Enter date after each listed item is completed

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent

X Operator Name Change Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 12-31-2001

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
AMOCO PRODUCTION COMPANY BP AMERICA PRODUCTION COMPANY
Address: 501 WESTLAKE PARK BLVD Address: 501 WESTLAKE PARK BLVD

HOUSTON, TX 77079 HOUSTON,TX 77079
Phone: 1-(281)-366-5328 Phone: 1-(281)-366-5328
Account NOO50 Account N1990

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)

API ENTITY SEC. TWN LEASE WELL WELL
NAME NO. NO. RNG TYPE TYPE STATUS
CHAMPLIN 387 BlA 43-043-30168 1404 09-3N-7E FEE GW S
ISLAND RANCH D-1 43-043-30161 1380 14-4N-7E FEE GW S
CHAMPLIN 372 D-1 43-043-30170 1405 23-4N-7E FEE GW P
CHAMPLIN 372 D-1 43-043-30170 10957 23-4N-7E FEE GW P
CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1 SDTRK 1 43-043-30143 1395 23-4N-8E FEE GW P
CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1 SDTRK 1 43-043-30143 10955 23-4N-8E FEE GW P

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 12/13/2001

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 12/13/2001

3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on:

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH 4-KAS

2. CDW v' 5-LP
3. JLT 6-FILE

Enter date after each listed item is completed

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent

X Operator Name Change Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 12-31-2001

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
AMOCO PRODUCTION COMPANY BP AMERICA PRODUCTION COMPANY
Address: 501 WESTLAKE PARK BLVD Address: 501 WESTLAKE PARK BLVD

HOUSTON, TX 77079 HOUSTON,TX 77079
Phone: 1-(281)-366-5328 Phone: 1-(281)-366-5328
Account NOO50 Account N1990

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)

API ENTITY SEC. TWN LEASE WELL WELL
NAME NO. NO. RNG TYPE TYPE STATUS
CHAMPLIN 387 BlA 43-043-30168 1404 09-3N-7E FEE GW S
ISLAND RANCH D-1 43-043-30161 1380 14-4N-7E FEE GW S
CHAMPLIN 372 D-1 43-043-30170 1405 23-4N-7E FEE GW P
CHAMPLIN 372 D-1 43-043-30170 10957 23-4N-7E FEE GW P
CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1 SDTRK 1 43-043-30143 1395 23-4N-8E FEE GW P
CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1 SDTRK 1 43-043-30143 10955 23-4N-8E FEE GW P

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 12/13/2001

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 12/13/2001

3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on:



4. Is the new operator registered in the State Utah: YES Business Number: PENDING

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on: N/A

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change) for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: N/A

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator
for wells listed on: N/A

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,
for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 12/18/2001

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 12/14/2001

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 12/14/2001

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 12/11/2001

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 12/18/2001

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

INDIAN BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEDERAL BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
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2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 12/19/2001
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for wells listed on: N/A

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A
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The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 12/19/2001



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER:

FEE
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL / OTHER Champlin 372 C-1

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

Amoco Production Company 4304330143
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

P.O. Box 3092 Houston TX ,77253-3092 (281) 366-5798 Anschutz Ranch
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 860' FNL x 536' FWL COUNTY: Summit

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNW 23 4N 7E S STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE O TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:
3/2/2001 O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The Champlin 372 C-1 well was logging off due to high water rates. The 3-1/2" tubingstring was pulled. A small hole in the
casing at 3615' was repaired with a casing patch. The casing was then tested to 1000 psig to ensure integrity. A 4.5" liner
was run to the sidetrack liner top and a 2-3/8" tubingstring and ECP were inserted into the horizontal open-hole section of the
well in order to increase velocity and reduce water influx (see attached wellbore diagram for details).

EP EEA TDATE PrO ct Engin

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse
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AMOCO PRODUCTIONCO. WELLBORE DL W
Fleid: Anschutz Martil

UPDATED: 30082051 Well: CH 372 C #1
SEC: 23 TWP: 4N RGE: /E

SubrnRise br: J. Lowe
KB 16.70'

DEPTH KB
ingram Caclus 11" 3M by 7" SM um2 bollom &0" boni
Itig Spool (7" 26#cagsiublanded h ergis)

Note: Casing pressure tested from 0-3600
lo 1000 psig 2/16¢01 - passed

9 5/8" 32 30 H-40 ST & C cag set al 1518' I

ag or F: HOLE BI CSG at 3612'
C asuu pMch set from 3552' to 3635')

2-3/8"4.7# EUESmd Tubing

Annulus pressure tested to 1000 psig (2/27/2001)

4-1/2" 12 60# Tubing run to surface
New Vam Beveled Couplings

4-1/2" Liner Top wilhBPR
Cement iop 7" per CBL an 2/15498 Cemented in place at 5090'
logged by Schlumbergerat 4906'+ - Inlialible packer

Whipslock at 560&MD(5513' TVD)

shoe reso no TD = 8608' MD
Twin Creek & Nugget squeezedolfas fonows. 6648' TVD
2r12/9!I pumoeti410 se G + addlites raocressure 7" 26# S-95 &K-55 casing - 2296 62' MIN MAX
Pr1 1/98 ruminati 10th 9. G smal a 2tkl ar G'• atitlarers ID
nu uressure Coment cap at 6018 22 - taggedvia Ibg
2r14/98 wumnati 50st 10-0 RFC unri chinin 1950 m sutsene
2r 14:25 ruume 2Dsa 'G for toneelsmi can ur1lun al rwkeriet Hallinstan Model "HCS" cement relainer 5 5" 0051 90'

(sel via Ibg - Honom al 6054 11')

cutoir23fe•47eN-80CShydraag 1901· 237r 6071'

omr 23WCBto23Wird 1901" 3062· 60894W
---- Spacer lube 1 001" 2 37r 6090 29

Baker model A 5 dual packer 1 901" 6097 0002.81'
Enanor.lair-MutLMuta
Spacer tutie.X over,2 3W pup. Model T hpd Spacer tube 1 901" 2 avr 6096 13'
trrnsub 2 3W pup. Model W nippio. ParFd pup, - X-Ouer: 2 3W to 2 3W 10rd to Sid 1 901 2 87s• 6099 43'
1ji 2 3W Ibg, Baker modBI"R" nipple,Mule shoe X-Ouer: 2 318" to2 7W Brd 1 901 3 co- 6099 75'
A g ODa & IDs ID 1 901" & OD 2 97 Þerrd tubing:4 shols (4 spi) 6103 57
Omralliength 4873
Eol al614154

29jis af 2 7/8"6 50 GidIbg 2 441• 3 eer 6100 07
Tbg collars 3 666" - Tube: 2 875"

Baker Model '?" nipple 1 87" 3 6675• 6994.86'
X 1jtof27Æ•65#8rdibg 2441" 366r 699587'

BakermodelG· assembly 23406" 3 4687W 70 5'

sakermodelao-82seal anaembly 2 406" 2 68e" 7036 66
X Over: 2 3W 10rd BX by BX 1 90W 3 062• 7037 09'
X-Ouer: 2 3W NU to EU 1 90V 3 06r 7037 46'
1jiof2318"EUBrd 1901" 3062" 706912'

FISH: 2 3/8" tbg [251 PBT_D

Prod C.isinq
7" 23# 8 26# at 7300 25

TD 7300
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6.NI NDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° ANSCHUTZ RANCH EASTdrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL Q GAS WELL Q OTHER

CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
BP AMERICA PRODUCTION COMPANY SUITE A 4304330143

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1013 CHEYENNE DR. EVANSTON my WY 282930 (303) 423-5749 ANSCHUTZ RANCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 860 FNL X 536 FWL COUNTY: SUMMIT

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNW 23 4N 7E STATE:
UTAH

ii. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUB1NGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGAND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER:

CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The Champlin 372 Amoco C 1 is shut in and has not been plugged and abandoned due to potential for sidetrack or deep drill.
BP's plan is to hold these wells in a Temporarily Abandoned status until this potential is verified or eliminated. Upon
elimination of potential, the wells will be plugged and abandoned. As for mechanical integrity: These wells all have packers
installed and casing pressure is monitored by our field personnel. The wellhead valves are also on a regular PM for greasing
and testing.

Please call Kris Lee at 303-423-5749 or Clark Lawler at 307-783-2406 if you have questions.

752tTIOOPERATOR CENED

THIS SUNDRY IS BEING RETURNED; INSU BMITT 19 ÖŸE
THE REQUESTED ACTION (see attached sheet).

November 19, 2003
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

NAME(PLEASE PRI ) Kristina A.Lee TITLE Regulatory Specialist

SIGNATURE DATE 3/17/2003

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse
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(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse



INFORMATION REQUIRED
TO EXTEND SI/TA OF WELL

Well Name and Number: Champlin 372 AMOCO Cl
API Number: 43-043-30143
Operator: Merit Energy Company
Reference Document: Original Sundry dated March 17, 2003, received by

DOGM on March 27, 2003

The well has been Shut-in/Temporarily Abandoned for 1 vear 9 months. Insufficient information
was submitted to the Division to approve the referenced well for continued Shut-in or Temporary
Abandonment (SI/TA). The following requirements of R649-3-36 have not been met with this
request for SI/TA approval.

1. The length of time the well is expected to be SI/TA (R649-3-36-1.2), and
2. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well has integrity,

meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition, static fluid level, pressure,
existence or absence of Underground Sources of Drinking Water and other factors do
not make the well a risk to public health and safety or the environment. (R649-3-36-
1.3)

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity and may help qualify
your well for extended SI/TA. Note: As of July 1, 2003, wells in violation of the SI/TA rule
R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-1-4.2, 4.3).

1. Wellbore diagram and;
2. Copy of recent casing pressure test and/or;
3. Current pressures on the wellbore (tubing pressure, casing pressure, and casing/casing

annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity and;
4. Fluid level in the wellbore and;
5. An explanation of how the submitted information proves integrity.

If the required information is not received within 30 days of the date of this notice, further
actions may be initiated. If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me at
(801) 538-5281.

I November 19, 2003
Dustin K. Doucet Date
Petroleum
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIALNUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to See Attacheddrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER See Attached

See Attached
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
BP America Production Company Attached

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:
501 WestLake Park Blv Houston TX >77079 (281) 366-2000 See Attached

4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See Attached COUNTY: See Attached

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

99. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

NOTICE OF INTENT
ACIDE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER:

O CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

BP America Production Company, effective May 1, 2003, has transferred its interest in the attached list of properties to :

Merit Energy Company
13727 Noel Road, Suite 500
Dallas, TX 75240

Transfer of operations is effective July 1, 2003.

By Merit Energy Company

Signature Date

BP America Production Company A
NAME (PLEASE PRINT . g, gf g@4 TITLE attomey-In-Fact

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
JULO3 2003

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&
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1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER See Attached

See Attached
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
BP America Production Company Attached

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:
501 WestLake Park Blv Houston TX >77079 (281) 366-2000 See Attached

4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See Attached COUNTY: See Attached

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

99. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

NOTICE OF INTENT
ACIDE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER:

O CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

BP America Production Company, effective May 1, 2003, has transferred its interest in the attached list of properties to :

Merit Energy Company
13727 Noel Road, Suite 500
Dallas, TX 75240

Transfer of operations is effective July 1, 2003.

By Merit Energy Company

Signature Date

BP America Production Company A
NAME (PLEASE PRINT . g, gf g@4 TITLE attomey-In-Fact

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
JULO3 2003

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&



BP OPERATED PROPERTIES TRANSFERRED TO MERIT ENERGY COMPANY

API Well Number Operator Well Name Well Type Well Status Field Name County Name Location (Twp-Rng) Section Qtr/Qtr FL NS NS FL EW EW43-043-30096-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W16-14 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 16 NWSW 2137 S 686 W43-043-30106-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE 34-2 Water Disposal Active Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH SUMMIT 4N-7E 34 NWNW 1036 N 1100 W43-043-30123-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W20-08 Gas Well Shut_in ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 20 SENE 2202 N 1592 E43-043-30129-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE 29-04ST1 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 29 NWNW 627 N 435 W43-043-30130-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE E21-14 Gas Well Shut_in ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 21 NWSW 2365 S 200 W43-043-30135-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W21-04 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 21 NWNW 1063 N 401 W43-043-30136-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W2942 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZRANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E - 29 NWNE 662 N 2460 E43-043-30138-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W16-06 Gas Well ShW In ANSCHUTZRANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 16 SENE 1314 N 618 E43-043-30139-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ISLAND RANCHING C-1 Water Disposal Active Well ANSCHUTZRANCH SUMMIT 4N-7E 26 SWSE 1324 S 1722 E43-043-30143-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZRANCH SUMMIT 4N-7E 23 NWNW 860 N 536 W43-043-30145-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W20-14 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZRANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 20 NWSW 1518 S 1283 W43-043-30148-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W20-16 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-SE 20 SWSE 257 S 1640 E43-043-30154-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W29-12 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 29 NWSW 2204 S 22 W43-043-30156-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W30-16 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 30 NESE 1345 S 968 E43-043-30157-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W36-16 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-7E 36 SESE 890 S 447 E43-043-30159-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W20-06 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 20 NWNW 1291 N 936 W43-043-30162-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W32-04 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 32 NWNW 642 N 791 W43-043-30164-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W31-08 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 31 NWNE 468 N 2201 E43-043-30165-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W31-04E Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 31 NWNW 111 N 737 W43-043-30167-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W36-08 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-7E 36 SENE 1641 N 1183 E43-043-30168-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO CHAMPLIN387 B1A Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH SUMMIT 3N-7E 9 SWNW 1837 N 1286 W43-043-30170-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO CHAMPUN 372 D-1 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH SUMMIT 4N-7E 23 NESE 2170 S 680 E43-043-30176-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W17-16 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 17 NWSE 1765 S 1444 E43-043-30183-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W30-08 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N4E 30 SENE 2109 N 665 E43-043-30185-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W30-14 Gas Well Shut_in ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 30 SESW 1195 S 1405 W43-043-30188-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE WO1-06 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 3N-7E 1 SENW 1777 N 1666 W43-043-30190-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO AREW31-12 Gas Well Shut In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 31 SWNW 1778 N 640 W43-043-30204-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W19-16 Gas Well SM In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 19 SWSE 1229 S 1350 E43-043-30209-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W01-02 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 3N-7E 1 NENW 386 N 2013 W43-043-30215-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W30-10 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 30 NWSE 2230 S 2432 E43-043-30216-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W30-15 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 30 SESW 626 S 2848 E43-043-30217-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W31-06 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 31 SENW 1397 N 2181 W43-043-30218-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W30-02 Gas Well SM_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 30 NWNE 715 N 2182 E43-043-30220-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W20-12 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 20 NWSW 2531 S 7 W43-043-30226-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE E28-06 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 28 SENW 1900 N 1652 W43-043-30227-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W36-10 Gas Well Shut in ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-7E 36 NESW 2315 S 3185 E43-043-30228-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W20-02 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 20 NWNE 319 N 2000 E43-043-30229-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W20-10 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 20 SENW 2560 N 2567 W43-043-30231-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W16-12 Gas Well Shut in ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 16 SWNW 2756 S 454 W43-043-30238-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W20-04 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 20 NWNW 702 N 414 W43-043-30248-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W30-12A Gas injection Inactive Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 30 NWSW 1886 S 47 W43-043-30250-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W29-06A Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 29 SENW 1513 N 1548 W43-043-30251-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W29-14A Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 29 NWSW 1786 S 795 W43-043-30255-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W36-14 Gas Well Shut In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-7E 36 SESW 901 S 1780 W43-043-30257-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE E28-12 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 28 NWSW 1994 S 806 W43-043-30265-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W2-10 Gas injection inactive Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 3N-7E 2 NWSE 1959 S 1463 E43-043-30270-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE WD1-04 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 3N-7E 1 SWNW 697 N 465 W43-043-30271-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE WO1-12 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 3N-7E 1 NWSW 2072 S 1669 W43-043-30272-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W19-08 Gas injection Inactive Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 19 SENE 2227 N 301 E

PROPERTIES TRANSFERED TO MERIT

BP OPERATED PROPERTIES TRANSFERRED TO MERIT ENERGY COMPANY

API Well Number Operator Well Name Well Type Well Status Field Name County Name Location (Twp-Rng) Section Qtr/Qtr FL NS NS FL EW EW43-043-30096-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W16-14 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 16 NWSW 2137 S 686 W43-043-30106-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE 34-2 Water Disposal Active Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH SUMMIT 4N-7E 34 NWNW 1036 N 1100 W43-043-30123-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W20-08 Gas Well Shut_in ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 20 SENE 2202 N 1592 E43-043-30129-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE 29-04ST1 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 29 NWNW 627 N 435 W43-043-30130-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE E21-14 Gas Well Shut_in ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 21 NWSW 2365 S 200 W43-043-30135-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W21-04 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 21 NWNW 1063 N 401 W43-043-30136-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W2942 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZRANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E - 29 NWNE 662 N 2460 E43-043-30138-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W16-06 Gas Well ShW In ANSCHUTZRANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 16 SENE 1314 N 618 E43-043-30139-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ISLAND RANCHING C-1 Water Disposal Active Well ANSCHUTZRANCH SUMMIT 4N-7E 26 SWSE 1324 S 1722 E43-043-30143-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZRANCH SUMMIT 4N-7E 23 NWNW 860 N 536 W43-043-30145-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W20-14 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZRANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 20 NWSW 1518 S 1283 W43-043-30148-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W20-16 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-SE 20 SWSE 257 S 1640 E43-043-30154-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W29-12 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 29 NWSW 2204 S 22 W43-043-30156-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W30-16 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 30 NESE 1345 S 968 E43-043-30157-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W36-16 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-7E 36 SESE 890 S 447 E43-043-30159-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W20-06 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 20 NWNW 1291 N 936 W43-043-30162-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W32-04 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 32 NWNW 642 N 791 W43-043-30164-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W31-08 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 31 NWNE 468 N 2201 E43-043-30165-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W31-04E Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 31 NWNW 111 N 737 W43-043-30167-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W36-08 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-7E 36 SENE 1641 N 1183 E43-043-30168-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO CHAMPLIN387 B1A Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH SUMMIT 3N-7E 9 SWNW 1837 N 1286 W43-043-30170-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO CHAMPUN 372 D-1 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH SUMMIT 4N-7E 23 NESE 2170 S 680 E43-043-30176-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W17-16 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 17 NWSE 1765 S 1444 E43-043-30183-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W30-08 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N4E 30 SENE 2109 N 665 E43-043-30185-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W30-14 Gas Well Shut_in ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 30 SESW 1195 S 1405 W43-043-30188-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE WO1-06 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 3N-7E 1 SENW 1777 N 1666 W43-043-30190-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO AREW31-12 Gas Well Shut In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 31 SWNW 1778 N 640 W43-043-30204-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W19-16 Gas Well SM In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 19 SWSE 1229 S 1350 E43-043-30209-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W01-02 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 3N-7E 1 NENW 386 N 2013 W43-043-30215-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W30-10 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 30 NWSE 2230 S 2432 E43-043-30216-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W30-15 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 30 SESW 626 S 2848 E43-043-30217-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W31-06 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 31 SENW 1397 N 2181 W43-043-30218-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W30-02 Gas Well SM_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 30 NWNE 715 N 2182 E43-043-30220-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W20-12 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 20 NWSW 2531 S 7 W43-043-30226-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE E28-06 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 28 SENW 1900 N 1652 W43-043-30227-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W36-10 Gas Well Shut in ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-7E 36 NESW 2315 S 3185 E43-043-30228-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W20-02 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 20 NWNE 319 N 2000 E43-043-30229-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W20-10 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 20 SENW 2560 N 2567 W43-043-30231-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W16-12 Gas Well Shut in ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 16 SWNW 2756 S 454 W43-043-30238-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W20-04 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 20 NWNW 702 N 414 W43-043-30248-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W30-12A Gas injection Inactive Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 30 NWSW 1886 S 47 W43-043-30250-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W29-06A Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 29 SENW 1513 N 1548 W43-043-30251-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W29-14A Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 29 NWSW 1786 S 795 W43-043-30255-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W36-14 Gas Well Shut In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-7E 36 SESW 901 S 1780 W43-043-30257-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE E28-12 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 28 NWSW 1994 S 806 W43-043-30265-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W2-10 Gas injection inactive Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 3N-7E 2 NWSE 1959 S 1463 E43-043-30270-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE WD1-04 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 3N-7E 1 SWNW 697 N 465 W43-043-30271-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE WO1-12 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 3N-7E 1 NWSW 2072 S 1669 W43-043-30272-00-00 BP AMERICAPRODUCTION CO ARE W19-08 Gas injection Inactive Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 19 SENE 2227 N 301 E

PROPERTIES TRANSFERED TO MERIT



BP OPERATED PROPERTIES TRANSFERRED TO MERITENERGY COMPANY

43-043-30273-00-00 BP AMERICA PRODUCTION CO ARE W30-06 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 30 SENW 2393 S 1645 W43-043-30277-00-00 BP AMERICA PRODUCTION CO ARE W11-1 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 3N-7E 11 NENE 533 N 1486 E43-043-30279-00-00 BP AMERICA PRODUCTION CO ARE W30-13 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-7E 25 SESE 597 S 382 E43-043-30280-00-00 BP AMERICA PRODUCTION CO ARE W31-05 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 31 SWNW 2361 N 252 E43-043-30283-00-00 BP AMERICA PRODUCTION CO ARE W12-04 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 3N-7E 2 SESE 373 S 865 E43-043-30286-00-00 BP AMERICA PRODUCTION CO ARE W20-09 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 20 SENE 2360 N 430 E43-043-30291-00-00 BP AMERICA PRODUCTION CO ARE W20-03 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 20 SESW 641 S 1810 W

PROPERTIES TRANSFERED TO MERIT

BP OPERATED PROPERTIES TRANSFERRED TO MERITENERGY COMPANY

43-043-30273-00-00 BP AMERICA PRODUCTION CO ARE W30-06 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 30 SENW 2393 S 1645 W43-043-30277-00-00 BP AMERICA PRODUCTION CO ARE W11-1 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 3N-7E 11 NENE 533 N 1486 E43-043-30279-00-00 BP AMERICA PRODUCTION CO ARE W30-13 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-7E 25 SESE 597 S 382 E43-043-30280-00-00 BP AMERICA PRODUCTION CO ARE W31-05 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 31 SWNW 2361 N 252 E43-043-30283-00-00 BP AMERICA PRODUCTION CO ARE W12-04 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 3N-7E 2 SESE 373 S 865 E43-043-30286-00-00 BP AMERICA PRODUCTION CO ARE W20-09 Gas Well Producing Well ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 20 SENE 2360 N 430 E43-043-30291-00-00 BP AMERICA PRODUCTION CO ARE W20-03 Gas Well Shut_In ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST SUMMIT 4N-8E 20 SESW 641 S 1810 W

PROPERTIES TRANSFERED TO MERIT



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET T GLH
2. CDW
3. FILE

X Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent/Operator

Operator Name Change Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 7/1/2003
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N1990-BP America Production Company N4900-Merit Energy Company

501 WestLake Park Blvd 13727 Noel Road, Suite 500
Houston, TX 77079 Dallas, TX 75240

Phone: (281) 366-2000 Phone: . (972) 628-1558

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)
NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL

NO TYPE TYPE STATUS
CHAMPLIN 387 B1A 09 030N 070E 4304330168 1404 FEE GW S
CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1 23 040N 070E 4304330143 1395 FEE GW S
CHAMPLIN 372 D-1 23 040N 070E 4304330170 1405 FEE GW P
ISLAND RANCHING C-1 26 040N 070E 4304330139 99990 FEE WD A
ARE 34-2 34 040N 070E 4304330106 99990 FEE WD A

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 7/3/2003

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 7/3/2003

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 8/7/2003

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 1348145-0143

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

6. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET T GLH
2. CDW
3. FILE

X Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent/Operator

Operator Name Change Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 7/1/2003
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N1990-BP America Production Company N4900-Merit Energy Company

501 WestLake Park Blvd 13727 Noel Road, Suite 500
Houston, TX 77079 Dallas, TX 75240

Phone: (281) 366-2000 Phone: . (972) 628-1558

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)
NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL

NO TYPE TYPE STATUS
CHAMPLIN 387 B1A 09 030N 070E 4304330168 1404 FEE GW S
CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1 23 040N 070E 4304330143 1395 FEE GW S
CHAMPLIN 372 D-1 23 040N 070E 4304330170 1405 FEE GW P
ISLAND RANCHING C-1 26 040N 070E 4304330139 99990 FEE WD A
ARE 34-2 34 040N 070E 4304330106 99990 FEE WD A

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 7/3/2003

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 7/3/2003

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 8/7/2003

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 1348145-0143

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

6. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN



7. Federal and Indian Lease Well The BLM and or the BIA has approved th merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: n/a

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: n/a

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,
for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 8/18/2003

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 8/26/2003

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 8/26/2003

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 8/26/2003

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 8/26/2003

STATE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond Number: n/a

FEDERAL WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: n/a

INDIAN WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: n/a

FEE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 103912218
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State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
PO Box 145801Michael O. Leavitt
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Robert L. Morgan (801) 538-5340 telephone
Executive Director (801) 359-3940 fax August 26, 2003
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Division Director www.nr utah.gov

Bruce Williams
BP America Production Company
501 WestLake Park Blvd
Houston, TX 77079

Subject: Notification of Sale or Transfer of Fee Lease Interest

Dear Mr. Williams:

The Division has processed your request for an operator change from BP America Production
Company to Merit Energy Company effective July 1, 2003 for the attached list of fee wells.

Utah Administrative Code Rule R649-2-10 states: "The owner of a lease shall provide
notification to any person with an interest in such lease, when all or part of that interest in the lease is
sold or transferred".

This letter is written to advise you of your responsibility to notify all individuals with an interest in
these leases (royalty interest and working interest) of the changer. Please provide written documentation of
this notification to:

Utah Royalty Owners Association
PO Box 1292
Roosevelt, Utah 84066

Your assistance in this matter is appreciated.

Sincerely,

Earlene Russell
Engineering Technician

Attachment

cc: Merit Energy Company
Utah Royalty Owners Association
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LOWELL P. BRAXTON
Division Director

Lance Taylor
Merit Energy Company
13727 Noel Road, Suite 500
Dallas, TX 75240-7312

Re: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned Well Requirements for Fee or
State Leases.

Dear Mr. Taylor:

Merit Energy Company, as of January 2004, has twenty-four (24) Fee Lease
Wells (see attachment A) that are currently in non-compliance for extended shut-in or
temporary abandonment status. This includes twenty (20) Fee Lease Wells with
returned Sundry Notices and attached requirement sheet dated November 19, 2003.
Wells SI/TA beyond twelve (12) consecutive months requires filing a Sundry Notice
(R649-3-36-1). Wells with five (5) years non-activity or non-productivity shall be
plugged, unless the Division grants approval for extended shut-in time upon a showing
of good cause by the operator (649-3-36-1.3.3). For extended SI/TA consideration the
operator shall provide the Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining with the following:

1. Reasons for SI/TA of the well (R649-3-36-1.1).
2. The length of time the well is expected to be SI/TA (R649-3-36-1.2),

and
3. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well

has integrity, meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition,
static fluid level, pressure, existence or absence of Underground
Sources of Drinking Water and other factors do not make the well a risk
to public health and safety or the environment (R649-3-36-1.3).

1594 West Nonh Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801 e
telephone (801) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7223 • www.ogm.utah.gor' Where ideas
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Page 2
January 22, 2004
Lance Taylor

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity andmay help qualify your well for extended SI/TA. Note: As of July 1, 2003, wells inviolation of the SI/TA rule R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-
1-4.2, 4.3).

1. Wellbore diagram, and
2. Copy of recent casing pressure test, and
3. Current pressures on the wellbore (tubing pressure, casing pressure, and

casing/casing annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity, and4. Fluid level in the wellbore, and
5. An explanation of how the submitted information proves integrity.

If the required information is not received within 30 days of the date of thisnotice, further actions may be initiated. If you have any questions concerning thismatter, please contact me at (801) 538-5281.

erely

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

Je
cc: John Baza

Well
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Well Name API Lease Type Years inactive1 ARE W20-06 43-043-30159 Fee 1 Year 2 Months2 ARE W31-04E 43-043-30165 Fee 1 Year 3 Months3 ARE W36-10 43-043-30227 Fee 1 Year 3 Months4 ARE W36-08 43-043-30167 Fee 1 Year 7 Months

Wells withreturned Suriry Notices and attached equirement sheet dated November 19, 20031 ARE W21-04 43-043-30135 Fee 1 Year 10 Months2 Champlin 372 Amoco C1 43-043-30143 Fee 1 Year 11 Months3 ARE W16-06 43-043-30138 Fee 1 Year 11 Months4 ARE WO1-12 43-043-30271 Fee 2 Years 4 Months5 ARE W30-02 43-043-30218 Fee 3 Years 2 Months6 ARE W36-14 43-043-30255 Fee 4 Years 5 Months7 ARE W30-06 43-043-30273 Fee 5 Years 4 Months8 ARE W20-02 43-043-30228 Fee 5 Years 4 Months9 ARE W30-13 43-043-30279 Fee 5 Years 6 Months10 ARE W19-16 43-043-30204 Fee 5 Years 8 Months11 ARE W20-4 43-043-30238 Fee 6 Years 3 Months12 ARE W31-12 43-043-30190 Fee 7 Years 3 Months13 ARE WO1-04 43-043-30270 Fee 7 Years 4 Months14 ARE W11-01 43-043-30277 Fee 7 Years 4 Months15 ARE W20-03 43-043-30291 Fee 8 Years 1 Month16 ARE W16-14 43-043-30096 Fee 8 Years 1 Month17 ARE 16-12 43-043-30231 Fee 8 Years 3 Months18 Champlin 387 B1A 43-043-30168 Fee 8 Years 6 Months19 ARE W17-16 43-043-30176 Fee 8 Years 7 Months20 ARE E21-14 43-043-30130 Fee 10 Years 8 Months
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January 22, 2004
Lance Taylor

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity and
may help qualify your well for extended SI/TA. Note: As of July 1, 2003, wells in
violation of the SI/TA rule R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-
1-4.2, 4.3).
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casing/casing annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity, and
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notice, further actions may be initiated. If you have any questions concerning this
matter, please contact me at (801) 538-5281.

erely
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Petroleum Engineer

je
cc: John Baza
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13727 Noel Road, Suite 500
Dallas, TX 75240
Ph: 972-701-8377 Fx: 972-960-1252

MER I T ENERGY COMP A NY www.meritenergy.com

Date: February 13, 2004

Subject: Extended Shut-in wells in the Anschutz Ranch East Field

Dear Mr. Doucet:

In response to your letter dated January 22, 2004, I would like to submit the attached supporting documentation
regarding our extended shut-in wells. Merit Energy Company purchased an operating interest in the Anschutz Ranch
East Unit from BP Production Company effective July 1, 2003, and has spent the last seven months evaluating the
production capability of all active and inactive wells in the field. This process has resulted in workovers that have
reestablished production in several of these wells, and revealed future opportunities for all of the others. Here is a
quick synopsis of our plans for each well.

• ARE W20-06- Workover is planned to immediately reactive this well by running smaller tubing, and putting
the well on gas lift. Should be reactivated by mid year 2004.

• ARE W31-04- BP attempted a directional reentry of this wellbore in 2001, during which time the drill pipe
was inadvertently cemented in the horizontal section of the wellbore. Merit is investigating methods to
effectively stimulate this wellbore and return it to production. If unable to do so, it will be plugged.

• ARE W36-10- This well will be the first test candidate for an experimental production method for artificial
lifting gas wells. An electric submersible pump will be run in this well in the next couple of months in an
attempt to reestablish production by removing large volumes of water from the formation. If this project is
successful it could lead to the reactivation of virtually every inactive well in the field. The project is
approved internally, and we are waiting on equipment and supplies before mobilizing a service rig.

• ARE W36-08- This well has been reactivated following a workover last fall. A sundry notice was filed and
approved by the Utah Oil and Gas Commission.

• ARE W21-04- Surface tubing pressure indicates this well may be capable of producing again. However
attempts to return this well to production with the current wellbore configuration have not been successful.
Merit plans to install smaller tubing and gas lift on this well. If that is unsuccessful, this well is also a
candidate for an electric submersible pump installation. If all attempts to reactivate the Nugget formation fail,
this well is a recompletion candidate in the Twin Creek formation.

• Champlin 372 C-1- This well is capable of producing for a few days at a time, but quickly loads up with
water and dies. Again, this well is a candidate for an electric submersible pump installation, or may be used
as a salt water disposal well if additional capacity is needed due to the ESP program.

• ARE W16-06- This well will have an electric submersible pump installed if the program is successful.
Otherwise it will be plugged.

• ARE WO1-12-This well will have an electric submersible pump installed if the program is successful. It is
also considered for an uphole recompletion.

• ARE W30-02- An attempt was made to return this well to production last fall, but was unsuccessful due to
high water production. Pending the success of the W36-10, this well will also have an electric submersible
pump installed.

• ARE W36-14- This well will have an electric submersible pump installed if the program is successful. It is
also considered for an uphole recompletion.

• ARE W30-06- This well will have an electric submersible pump installed if the program is successful. It is
also considered for an uphole recompletion.

• ARE W20-02- A workover has been approved internally to reactivate this well, and should begin in the next
few weeks A sundry notice was filed and approved by the Utah Oil and Gas Commission.

• ARE W30-13- This well will have an electric submersible pump installed if the program is successful. It is
also considered for an uphole recompletion.

• ARE W19-16- This well will have an electric submersible pump installed if the program is successful. It is
also considered for an uphole recompletion.
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• ARE W20-04- This well wi have an electric submersible pump installed itmo program is successful. It is
also considered for an uphole recompletion.

• ARE W31-12- An attempt was made to reactivate this well in late 2003, but was unsuccessful. A sundry
notice was filed and approved by the Utah Oil and Gas Commission. An uphole recompletion in the Twin
Creek formation is planned and will be completed in the next few months.

• ARE WO1-04- This well will have an electric submersible pump installed if the program is successful. It is
also considered for an uphole recompletion.

• ARE W11-01- This well will have an electric submersible pump installed if the program is successful.
Otherwise it will be plugged.

• ARE W20-03- This well will have an electric submersible pump installed if the program is successful. It is
also considered for an uphole recompletion.

• ARE W16-14- This well will have an electric submersible pump installed if the program is successful. It is
also considered for salt water disposal well if additional capacity is needed.

• ARE W16-12- This well will have an electric submersible pump installed if the program is successful. It is
also considered for salt water disposal well if additional capacity is needed.

• Champlin 387 B-1A- Merit Energy is in the process of obtaining records from BP for this well. Once
historical information is obtained, we will evaluate all feasible methods to return this well to producing status.
Otherwise it will be plugged.

• ARE W17-16- This well will have an electric submersible pump installed if the program is successful. It is
also considered for salt water disposal well if additional capacity is needed.

• ARE E21-14- This well was returned to producing status on 12/19/03.

In addition to this information, I have enclosed pressure data for all wells, and a wellbore schematic for all wells
except the Champlin 387 B-1A. The static bottom hole pressures and static fluid levels were collected in September
2003 with bottom hole gauges. If you need any further information, please contact me at 972-628-1651 or
electronically at lance.tavlor meritenergy.com.

Operations Engineer

Cc: Rusty Ginnetti
Arlene Valliquette
Dennis Longwell

Attachments: (1) page of pressure data, (23) wellbore schematics
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Retum-path: <Lance.Taylor@meritenergy.com>
Received: from imail.meritenergy.com [208.133.141.18]

by UTSTDP13.state.ut.us; Tue, 24 Feb 2004 07:06:49 -0700

Subject: Anschutz Ranch East Unit
To: clintondworshak@utah.gov
Cc: Rusty Ginnetti <Rusty.Ginnetti@meritenergy.com>,

Arlene Valliquette <Arlene.Valliquette@meritenergy.com>,
Dennis Longwell <Dennis.Longwell@meritenergy.com>

X-Mailer: Lotus Notes Release 5.0.10 March 22, 2002
Message-ID: <OF2FAC50A1.BE12C251-ON86256E44.004BO584-
86256E44.004D8670@meritenergy.com>
From: Lance Taylor <Lance.Taylor@meritenergy.com>
Date: Tue, 24 Feb 2004 08:06:46 -0600

X-MIMETrack: Serialize by Router on imail/Meritenergy(Release 6.0.3|September 26, 2003) at
02/24/2004 08:06:49 AM

I MIME-Version: 1.0
Content-type: text/plain;charset=US-ASCII

Mr. Dworshak,

I'd like to confirm our 2/23/04 telephone conversation in response to my
letter dated 2/13/04 regarding extended shut in and temporarilyabandoned
wellbores in the Anschutz Ranch East Unit ("ARE Unit") of Summit county
Utah. It is Merit Energy Company's intention to utilize each wellbore to
it's full capacity. As such, Merit is in the process of attempting to
reactivate the wellbores in question. Several wellbore specific workovers
have been identified, and the approximate timingof each is mentioned in my
original letter.

However, the majority of the reactivation work depends on the successful
utilization of electric submersible pumps for artificiallift. It is the
timingof this project that I would like to address. As you know, this is
a capital intensive project, so Merit plans to do the appropriate research
prior to implementation. Merit intends to test the idea on the ARE W36-10
within the next 8-12 weeks. Following a 4-12 week test period, Merit will
perform a strenuous economic and operational evaluation. If it is
determined that the project is valid, full scale implementation could begin
as early as June. However, due to the complexityof the equipment, depth
of the wells, and unavailability of service rigs, Merit anticipates this
project will take several months, possibly one year, to complete. Due to
the large volumes of water to be produced by this project, it is likely
that one or more of the shut in wells will need to be reactivated as salt
water disposal wells. AIIregulatory and state documentation will be
completed prior to SWD conversion.

Finally, if the ESP project is unsuccessful, several of these wellbore have
recompletion potential in shallower formations. Specifically, Merit has
identified the Jurassic aged Twin Creek formation as a possible
recompletiontarget. Completion practices must be researched and developed
in order to ensure economic quantities of hydrocarbons. Again, all state
and federal permits will be approved prior to project

Retum-path: <Lance.Taylor@meritenergy.com>
Received: from imail.meritenergy.com [208.133.141.18]

by UTSTDP13.state.ut.us; Tue, 24 Feb 2004 07:06:49 -0700

Subject: Anschutz Ranch East Unit
To: clintondworshak@utah.gov
Cc: Rusty Ginnetti <Rusty.Ginnetti@meritenergy.com>,

Arlene Valliquette <Arlene.Valliquette@meritenergy.com>,
Dennis Longwell <Dennis.Longwell@meritenergy.com>

X-Mailer: Lotus Notes Release 5.0.10 March 22, 2002
Message-ID: <OF2FAC50A1.BE12C251-ON86256E44.004BO584-
86256E44.004D8670@meritenergy.com>
From: Lance Taylor <Lance.Taylor@meritenergy.com>
Date: Tue, 24 Feb 2004 08:06:46 -0600

X-MIMETrack: Serialize by Router on imail/Meritenergy(Release 6.0.3|September 26, 2003) at
02/24/2004 08:06:49 AM

I MIME-Version: 1.0
Content-type: text/plain;charset=US-ASCII

Mr. Dworshak,

I'd like to confirm our 2/23/04 telephone conversation in response to my
letter dated 2/13/04 regarding extended shut in and temporarilyabandoned
wellbores in the Anschutz Ranch East Unit ("ARE Unit") of Summit county
Utah. It is Merit Energy Company's intention to utilize each wellbore to
it's full capacity. As such, Merit is in the process of attempting to
reactivate the wellbores in question. Several wellbore specific workovers
have been identified, and the approximate timingof each is mentioned in my
original letter.

However, the majority of the reactivation work depends on the successful
utilization of electric submersible pumps for artificiallift. It is the
timingof this project that I would like to address. As you know, this is
a capital intensive project, so Merit plans to do the appropriate research
prior to implementation. Merit intends to test the idea on the ARE W36-10
within the next 8-12 weeks. Following a 4-12 week test period, Merit will
perform a strenuous economic and operational evaluation. If it is
determined that the project is valid, full scale implementation could begin
as early as June. However, due to the complexityof the equipment, depth
of the wells, and unavailability of service rigs, Merit anticipates this
project will take several months, possibly one year, to complete. Due to
the large volumes of water to be produced by this project, it is likely
that one or more of the shut in wells will need to be reactivated as salt
water disposal wells. AIIregulatory and state documentation will be
completed prior to SWD conversion.

Finally, if the ESP project is unsuccessful, several of these wellbore have
recompletion potential in shallower formations. Specifically, Merit has
identified the Jurassic aged Twin Creek formation as a possible
recompletiontarget. Completion practices must be researched and developed
in order to ensure economic quantities of hydrocarbons. Again, all state
and federal permits will be approved prior to project



ÒIoton DWorshak - Mime.8 2 age 2

If after all our efforts to economicallyreactivate these wells fail, Merit
Energy will begin the plug and abandonment process. I trust this will
clear up any issues of timing. Ifyou have further questions or concerns
please feel free to contact me at any of the numbers below.

Regards,

Lance L. Taylor
Operations Engineer-Rockies Region
Merit Energy Company
direct: 972-628-1651
fax: 972-701-0351
mobile:972-998-9116
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MICHAEL O. LEAVITT
Governor

OLENE S. WALKER
Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah March 5, 2004

Department of
Natura1Resources CERTYFIED RETURN RECEIPT NO 7002 0510 0 003 8602 4880

Division of Mr. Lance Taylor
Oil, Gas & Mining Merit Energy Company

13727 Noel Road, Suite 500
ROBERT L. MORGAN Dallas, TX 75240Executive Director

LOWELL P. BRAXTON
Division Director

Re: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned Well Requirements for Fee or
State Leases dated January 22, 2004.

Dear Mr. Taylor,

The Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (DOGM) is in receipt of your letter dated
February 13, 2004 in regards to the twenty-four (24) shut-in wells operated by Merit
Energy Company (Merit). DOGM accepts Merit's plan of action to recomplete all
twenty-four wells by year-end 2004. Many of the recompletions are dependent upon
the success of electric submersible pumps; if this experimental procedure is not
successful, keep the Division advised of any changes in Merit's plan of action. Based
upon the plan of action and other information provided, DOGM approves the twenty-
four (24) wells for extended shut-in until January 1, 2005. Please submit recompletion
procedures and notice of intent sundries upon finalization.

For reference, Attachment A lists the wells subject to this request. If you have
any questions or need additional assistance in regards to the above matters please
contact me at (801) 538-5281.

cerely,

Dustin Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801 e
telephone (801) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 •TTY (801) 538-7223 • www.ogm.utah.gov Where ideas
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Well Name API Lease Type Years inactive
1 ARE W20-06 43-043-30159 Fee 1 Year 2 Months
2 ARE W31-04E 43-043-30165 Fee 1 Year 3 Months
3 ARE W36-10 43-043-30227 Fee 1 Year 3 Months
4 ARE W36-08 43-043-30167 Fee 1 Year 7 Months

Wells with returned Sundry Notices and attached equirement sheet dated November 19, 2003
1 ARE W21-04 43-043-30135 Fee 1 Year 10 Months
2 Champlin 372 Amoco C1 43-043-30143 Fee 1 Year 11 Months
3 ARE W16-06 43-043-30138 Fee 1 Year 11 Months
4 ARE WO1-12 43-043-30271 Fee 2 Years 4 Months
5 ARE W30-02 43-043-30218 Fee 3 Years 2 Months
6 ARE W36-14 43-043-30255 Fee 4 Years 5 Months
7 ARE W30-06 43-043-30273 Fee 5 Years 4 Months
8 ARE W20-02 43-043-30228 Fee 5 Years 4 Months
9 ARE W30-13 43-043-30279 Fee 5 Years 6 Months
10 ARE W19-16 43-043-30204 Fee 5 Years 8 Months
11 ARE W20-4 43-043-30238 Fee 6 Years 3 Months
12 ARE W31-12 43-043-30190 Fee 7 Years 3 Months
13 ARE WO1-04 43-043-30270 Fee 7 Years 4 Months
14 ARE W11-01 43-043-30277 Fee 7 Years 4 Months
15 ARE W20-03 43-043-30291 Fee 8 Years 1 Month
16 ARE W16-14 43-043-30096 Fee 8 Years 1 Month
17 ARE 16-12 43-043-30231 Fee 8 Years 3 Months
18 Champlin 387 B1A 43-043-30168 Fee 8 Years 6 Months
19 ARE W17-16 43-043-30176 Fee 8 Years 7 Months
20 ARE E21-14 43-043-30130 Fee 10 Years 8 Months

Attachment

Well Name API Lease Type Years inactive
1 ARE W20-06 43-043-30159 Fee 1 Year 2 Months
2 ARE W31-04E 43-043-30165 Fee 1 Year 3 Months
3 ARE W36-10 43-043-30227 Fee 1 Year 3 Months
4 ARE W36-08 43-043-30167 Fee 1 Year 7 Months

Wells with returned Sundry Notices and attached equirement sheet dated November 19, 2003
1 ARE W21-04 43-043-30135 Fee 1 Year 10 Months
2 Champlin 372 Amoco C1 43-043-30143 Fee 1 Year 11 Months
3 ARE W16-06 43-043-30138 Fee 1 Year 11 Months
4 ARE WO1-12 43-043-30271 Fee 2 Years 4 Months
5 ARE W30-02 43-043-30218 Fee 3 Years 2 Months
6 ARE W36-14 43-043-30255 Fee 4 Years 5 Months
7 ARE W30-06 43-043-30273 Fee 5 Years 4 Months
8 ARE W20-02 43-043-30228 Fee 5 Years 4 Months
9 ARE W30-13 43-043-30279 Fee 5 Years 6 Months
10 ARE W19-16 43-043-30204 Fee 5 Years 8 Months
11 ARE W20-4 43-043-30238 Fee 6 Years 3 Months
12 ARE W31-12 43-043-30190 Fee 7 Years 3 Months
13 ARE WO1-04 43-043-30270 Fee 7 Years 4 Months
14 ARE W11-01 43-043-30277 Fee 7 Years 4 Months
15 ARE W20-03 43-043-30291 Fee 8 Years 1 Month
16 ARE W16-14 43-043-30096 Fee 8 Years 1 Month
17 ARE 16-12 43-043-30231 Fee 8 Years 3 Months
18 Champlin 387 B1A 43-043-30168 Fee 8 Years 6 Months
19 ARE W17-16 43-043-30176 Fee 8 Years 7 Months
20 ARE E21-14 43-043-30130 Fee 10 Years 8 Months

Attachment



MERIT ENERGY COMPANY
13727 Noel Road Suite 500 Dallas, Texas 75240
Ph 972.701.8377 Fx 972.960.1252 - www.meritenergy.com

January 7, 2005

State of Utah - Department of Natural Resources
Divisionof Oil, Gas, & Mining
Attn: Mr. Dustin Doucet
PO Box 145801
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Dear Mr. Doucet:

This letter is in response to a telephoneconversationthat I had with Clint Dworshak on December 6,
2004. At that time, he requested that I provide information on Merit Energy Company's shut-in wells at
Anschutz Ranch East, proving that theground waters are protected.

Enclosed, please find a summary sheet, as well as wellbore diagrams for the subject wells.

If you have any questions or wish to discuss this further, please contact me at (972) 628-1550 or
electronically at mike.mercer@meritenerqv.com.

Michael L. Mercer

MERIT ENERGY COMPANY
13727 Noel Road Suite 500 Dallas, Texas 75240
Ph 972.701.8377 Fx 972.960.1252 - www.meritenergy.com

January 7, 2005

State of Utah - Department of Natural Resources
Divisionof Oil, Gas, & Mining
Attn: Mr. Dustin Doucet
PO Box 145801
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
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UYAH DOGM - SI WELL LIST

Wells to be Reactivated in 2005
• CHAMPLIN 372 C1

o Packer at 8,320 (MD) 6,648 (TVD)
o Top of cement (TOC) at 4,906
o Tubing Pressure 1250#
o Casing Pressure 0#
o The 4-1/2" liner is cemented in place at 5090 (below the TOC). The tubingpressure and

casing pressure are different. Therefore, the casing and tubingare not in communication
and the ground waters are protected.

• ARE W16-06
o Packer at 13,398
o Top of cement (TOC) at 12,640
o Tubing Pressure 0#
o Casing Pressure 0#
o The packer is located below the TOC. When Merit set the packer in October 2004, we

pressure tested the annulus to 500 psi and it held. Therefore, the casing has integrity and
the ground waters are protected.

• ARE W30-02
o Packerat none
o Top of cement (TOC) at 12,452
o Tubing Pressure 0#
o Casing Pressure 0#
o Fluid Level 8200' from Surface
o On 09/02/03, Merit ran a packer in thiswell and sat it at 13055' (below the TOC). The

casing and packer were pressure tested to 1500 psi and held. The packer has since been
removed and there is open-ended tubingin the well. However, the casing has integrity
and the ground waters are protected.

• ARE W36-14
o Packer at 13,988
o Top of cement (TOC) at 13,700
o Tubing Pressure 400#
o Casing Pressure 0#
o The packer is set below the TOC. The tubingpressure and casing pressure are different.

Therefore, the casing and tubing are not in communication and the ground waters are
protected.

• ARE W30-06
o Packer at 13,450
o Top of cement (TOC) at 11,200 (7" casing)
o Tubing Pressure 0#
o Casing Pressure 0#
o The packer is set below the TOC. The 9-5/8" casing string has cement fl 11911-7940.

The 13-3/8" casing has cement fl 5745-1200. With no pressure on the casing, and three
strings of casing (7", 9-5/8", 13-3/8"), the ground waters are protected.

• ARE W30-13
o Packer at 12,320
o Top of cement (TOC) at 12,200
o Tubing Pressure 300#
o Casing Pressure 0#
o The packer is set below the TOC. The tubingpressure and casing pressure are different.

Therefore, the casing and tubing are not in communication and the ground waters are
protected.
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UTAH DOGM - SI WELL LIST

• ARE W31-12
o Packerat none
o Top of cement (TOC) at 10,700
o Casing Pressure 100#
o Fluid Level 1000' from Surface
o There is not a packer or tubingin thiswell. The static fluid level is 1000' from surface.

There is a 13-3/8" casing string set at 2846', a 9-5/8" casing string set at 10272', and a 7"
tie-backcasing string set at 9919'. These three casing strings are protecting the ground
waters.

Wells with No Immediate Plans
• ARE W31-04

o Packer at 14,000
o Top of cement (TOC) at 11,900
o Tubing Pressure 1100#
o Casing Pressure 50#
o This well is a horizontal sidetrack. The primary cement job on the original production

casing had a TOC at 11,900. The kick-off point for the horizontal leg is below this depth.
Additionally, the drill string was cemented in the horizontal section with the TOC
estimated to be between 13126 and 13310. Based on the fact that the tubing and casing
pressures are different, the twoare not in communication and therefore, the ground
waters are protected.

• ARE WO1-12
o Packer at 14,317
o Top of cement (TOC) at 14,290
o Tubing Pressure 300#
o Casing Pressure 0#
o The packer is located below the TOC. The tubingpressure and casing pressure are

different. Therefore, the casing and tubing are not in communication and the ground
waters are protected.

• ARE W19-16
o Packer at 9,756
o Top of cement (TOC) at unknown
o Tubing Pressure 1000#
o Casing Pressure 0#
o The packer is located in the "Tie-Back" casing string. The tubingpressure and casing

pressure are different. Therefore, the casing and tubing are not in communication and the
ground waters are protected.

• ARE W20-04
o Packer (PBR) at 10,489
o Top of cement (TOC)at 9,415 (9-5/8" & 9-7/8" casing string)
o Tubing Pressure 0#
o Casing Pressure 0#
o Fluid Level 9600' from Surface
o The tubing is tied into the 5" liner with a polish bore receptacle (PBR) at 10,489. The TOC

for the intermediate casing is above thispoint (at 9,415). The static fluid level is at 9600'
(below the TOC), therefore,the ground waters are protected.

• ARE WO1-04
o Packer at 13,891
o Top of cement (TOC) at 13,600
o Tubing Pressure 1400#
o Casing Pressure 100#
o The packer is located below the TOC. The tubing pressure and casing pressure are

different. Therefore, the casing and tubingare not in communication and the ground
waters are protected.
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UVAH DOGM - SI WELL LIST

• ARE W11-01
o Packer at 12,733
o Top of cement (TOC) at 12,100
o Tubing Pressure 1500#
o Casing Pressure 50#
o The packer is located below the TOC. The tubing pressure and casing pressure are

different. Therefore, the casing and tubingare not in communication and the ground
waters are protected.

• ARE W20-03
o Packer at 13,271
o Top of cement (TOC) at 12,600
o Tubing Pressure 1400#
o Casing Pressure 75#
o The packer is located below the TOC. The tubingpressure and casing pressure are

different. Therefore, the casing and tubing are not in communication and the ground
waters are protected.

• ARE W16-14
o Packer (PBR) at 10,500
o Top of cement (TOC) at 9,650 (9-5/8" casing)
o Tubing Pressure 1500#
o Casing Pressure 850#
o The tubingis tied into the 4-1/2" liner witha PBR at 10,500. This is below the TOC for the

9-5/8" casing string. The tubingpressure and casing pressure are different. Therefore,
the casing and tubingare not in communication and the ground waters are protected.

• ARE W16-12
o Packer at 10,304
o Top of cement (TOC) at 10,100 (9-5/8" casing)
o Tubing Pressure 50#
o Casing Pressure 0#
o The packer is located below the TOC. The tubingpressure and casing pressure are

different. Therefore, the casing and tubing are not in communication and the ground
waters are protected.

• CHAMPLIN 387 B1A
o Tubing Pressure 0#
o Casing Pressure 0#
o Fluid Level 5200' from surface
o Merit has no wellfiles regarding thiswell. We are currently tryingto obtain information on

thiswell
• ARE W17-16

o Packer (PBR) at 10,237
o Top of cement (TOC) at 10,371 (7-5/8" casing)
o Tubing Pressure 0#
o Casing Pressure 0#
o Fluid Level 8400' from Surface
o The tubing is tied into the 5" liner with a PBR at 10,237. There is a 13-3/8" casing string

set at 2526', a 9-5/8" casing string set at 10701', and a 7" tie-backcasing string set at
10237'. These threecasing strings are protecting the ground waters.
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MERIT ENERGY COMPANY
Anschutz Ranch East Unit

API Tubing Casing STATUS Static Fluid
WELLS Number Pressure Pressure ON / OFF Static BHP Level

1 ARE# W20-06 43-043-30159 100 200 Shut In 1835 7500-9000'

2 ARE# W31-04E 43-043-30165 1200 0 Shut In ? ?

3 ARE# W36-10 43-043-30227 100 0 Shut In 3042 7500-9000'

4 ARE# W36-08 43-043-30167 100 100 Producing 2844 6000-7500'

Wells with returned Sur dry Notices and a tached requirem int sheet dated 6 ovember 19, 20 )3

1 ARE# W21-04 43-043-30135 1850 450 Shut In 4130 12000'
Champlin Š72

2 Amoco #C-1 43-043-30143 0 0 Shut In ? ?

3 ARE# W16-06 43-043-30138 0 0 Shut In ? ?
4 ARE# WO1-12 43-043-30271 600 0 Shut In 4181 7500-9000'

5 ARE# W30-02 43-043-30218 0 0 Shut In ? ?

6 ARE# W36-14 43-043-30255 2200 1500 Shut In 3420 Perfs

7 ARE# W30-06 43-043-30273 0 0 Shut In 2397 6000-7500'

8 ARE# W20-02 43-043-30228 100 100 Shut In ? ?

9 ARE# W30-13 43-043-30279 900 0 Shut In 3030 7500-9000'

10 ARE# W19-16 43-043-30204 1400 0 Shut In 2645 Perfs

11 ARE# W20-04 43-043-30238 0 0 Shut In ? ?

12 ARE# W31-12 43-043-30190 20 450 Shut In 3494 4500-6000'

13 ARE# WO1-04 43-043-30270 Shut In 4505 7500-9000'

14 ARE# W11-01 43-043-30277 1300 50 Shut In 4575 6000-7500'

15 ARE# W20-03 43-043-30291 1800 75 Shut In 3890 10500'

16 ARE# W16-14 43-043-30096 0 800 Shut In 4570 6000-7500'

17 ARE#16-12 43-043-30231 0 0 Shut In 4781 1500-3000'
Champlin 387

18 #B-1A 43-043-30168 0 0 Shut In ? ?

19 ARE# W17-16 43-043-30176 1100 0 Shut In 4734 3000-4500'

20 ARE# E21-14 43-043-30130 200 150 Producing 3926 Perfs

RECEIVED
FEB2 0 2004

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&
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MERIT ENERGY COMPANY
Anschutz Ranch East Unit

API Tubing Casing STATUS Static Fluid
WELLS Number Pressure Pressure ON / OFF Static BHP Level
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Dustin Doticet -Re ŠlÏÏÄinjegrliyquestions Page 1

From: Mike Mercer <Mike.Mercer@meritenergy.com>
To: "Dustin Doucet" <dustindoucet@utah.gov>

Date: 4/7/2005 3:12:05 PM
Subject: Re: SI/TA integrity questions

On the W16-14, the production foreman did have to replace the gauge to get
the new (correct) reading.

On the W17-16, the pressures and fluid levels were actuallytakenoffof a
swab report (theydid not get "static" readings), which explains why the
fluid level (and tubingpressure) was so much lower.

Hope this takes care of you, if not, please call.

Thanks

Michael L. Mercer
Engineering
Merit Energy Company
13727 Noel Road, Suite 500
Dallas, TX 75240
(972) 628-1550 Direct
(972) 960-1252 Fax

"Dustin Doucet"
<dustindoucet@uta

h.gov> To
<Mike.Mercer@meritenergy.com>

03/11/2005 04:14 cc
PM

Subject
Re: SI/TA integrity questions

Mike,

Thanks for the info. A couple more questions. On the 16-14 and 17-16
do you figure the readings or guages were incorrect last year or is
their some other reason for the change in pressures?
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Dustin Doucet - Re: SI/TA integrity questions Page 2

>>> Mike Mercer <Mike.Mercer@meritenergy.com> 03/11/05 1:48 PM >>>

Dustin,

Sorry it has taken me so long to get back with you...in response to
your
email, most are easily explained...(see below in red)

Regarding the W30-14, we are installing ESPs on either side of this
well,
we have a service company designing gas liftfor this well and are
evaluating a reactivation following the ESP installations. Ifwe do
not
have t_hewell reactivated in the next couple of months, Iwill provide
you
with the wellbore diagram, pressures, and fluid level.

Let me know ifyou need anything else. Thanks

Michael L. Mercer
Engineering
Merit Energy Company
13727 Noel Road, Suite 500
Dallas, TX 75240
(972) 628-1550 Direct
(972) 960-1252 Fax

"Dustin Doucet"

<dustindoucet@uta

h.gov>
To

<mike.mercer@meritenergy.com>

02/16/2005 04:04
cc

PM

Subject
SI/TA integrity
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Dustin Doucet - Re SI/TAintegrity questions Page 3

Mike,

I finally looked at the packet you provided us at our January 10th
meeting and had questions that you may be able to answer on four
wells.
My questions deal with pressure and fluid level changes that I didn't
have enough info to explain why they changed. Also, Iwant to give
you
a heads up that another well came on to the SI/TA list this year. It
is
the ARE W 30-14 (API 43-043-30185). A similarplanlintegrity scenario
will have to be followed on this well as we've done with the current
SIITA wells. The four wells that I had questions on are as follows:

Champlin 372 - Tbg pressure went from 0 last year to 1250 psi this
year SWABTESTECTMg

ARE W 36-14 - Tbg pressure went from 2200 to 400 psi, csg pressure
went •

from 1500 to O WE PULLED THE OLD PKR, RAN A TESÏŸ¾ŠÑÄ§§EDTESTED,

A"F ÈRAVE HAD PROBLEMS, BUT WE HAVE ESTABLISHED COMMERCIAL
RRJDUCTION)

ARE W 16-14 - Tbg pressure went from 0 to 1500 psi, csg pressure did
stay constant at ~ 850psi which is probably good, although pressure on
the backside doesn't make me feel all warm and fuzzy WE HAVE NOT DONE
ANYTHING

ARE W 17-16 - Tbg pressure went from 1100 to 0 psi, FL went from 4000'
to 8400' opposite of what you would expect hydrostatically based off
of
the pressure change SWAB TESTED 2004 (FUTURREsfiNSTWiAñÑ)
AIIin all I don't have a lot of concern for lack of integrity, but if
you could provide me with some explanations as to why some of these
changes occured on these 4 wells, I would appreciate it. The good
news
is that you are reactivating two of the four wells this year.
Hopefully, this email makes some sense. Give me a call if you like
and
we can discuss or respond via email. Thanks.

Dustin

Dustin Doucet
Petroleum
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stay constant at ~ 850psi which is probably good, although pressure on
the backside doesn't make me feel all warm and fuzzy WE HAVE NOT DONE
ANYTHING

ARE W 17-16 - Tbg pressure went from 1100 to 0 psi, FL went from 4000'
to 8400' opposite of what you would expect hydrostatically based off
of
the pressure change SWAB TESTED 2004 (FUTURREsfiNSTWiAñÑ)
AIIin all I don't have a lot of concern for lack of integrity, but if
you could provide me with some explanations as to why some of these
changes occured on these 4 wells, I would appreciate it. The good
news
is that you are reactivating two of the four wells this year.
Hopefully, this email makes some sense. Give me a call if you like
and
we can discuss or respond via email. Thanks.

Dustin

Dustin Doucet
Petroleum



MERIT ENERGY COMPANY
13727 Noel Road Suite 500 Dallas, Texas 75240
Ph 972.701.8377 Fx 972.960.1252 www.meritenergycom

November 10, 2004

State of Utah - Department of Natural Resources
Divisionof Oil, Gas, & Mining
Attn: Mr. Dustin Doucet
PO Box 145801
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Dear Mr. Doucet:

In a letter dated February 13, 2004, Merit Energy Company informed the DOGM of plans toreactivate
twenty-four(24) shut-in wells. Based on thisinformation, on March 5, 2004, the DOGM granted Merita
shut-in extension until January 1, 2005. In April, the engineer working the Anschutz Ranch East
(Anschutz) field left Merit. He was replaced by a second engineer thatleft Merit in August. As a result of
this tumover, there has been no continuity at Anschutz. Regretfully, Merit will not have these wells
reactivated t)yJanuary 1, 2005.

I took over as the Operations Engineer at Anschutz in August. On October 6, 2004, I called to discuss
thissituationwith you. You requested thatMerit submit a letter statingwhat work has been completed
as well as our future plans.

The largest problem at Anschutz is water. Several wells have loaded up and died as a result of water
production. Merit has been investigating several methods to remove the water and reestablish
commercialgas production.

"Co-production"
As outlined in the February letter, Merit had plans to attempt "co-production" at Anschutz. "Co-
production" is simply utilizingan electric submersible pump (ESP) to remove the water. Our first test
candidate was the ARE W36-10. On July 15, 2004, we started the ESP. To date, results have been
exceptional. The maximum gas rate thatwe have seen is 355 mcfd. This is more thanenough to justify
thecost of the installation. Average production has been 200 mcfdand 1200 bwpd.

The only drawback to "co-production" is installing power to location. Without knowing how the well will
perform, Merit is hesitant to invest the capital upfront for power installation. Additionally, it tookthe
power company approximately six months to perform the installation.

Although Merit is pleased with the results of "co-production",we have developed a new plan. We are
currently preparing a generator to provide temporarypower to location. Future installations will be
performed on a temporarybasis. Ifthewell proves to be a success, an order for permanent power will
be placed with the power company. This allows Merit the flexibilityto test several shut-in wells without
spending unnecessary capital.

We are currentlyin the process of preparing the ARE W16-06 for an ESP installation. Additional wells
that are currentlyidentified for potential ESP installations are the ARE W30-02, W30-06, W30-13, and
W36-14. Merit anticipates having these wells tested during 2005. Further installations will be
determined based on the success of theabove mentioned wells.

RECEIVED
NOV12 2W4

L,GAS&
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Capillary Strings
Merit has also begun utilizingcapillary strings to inject soap downhole to assist the well in liftingthe
produced water. We currentlyhave five (5) capillary strings in service at Anschutz and are planning on
installing four (4) more before theend of theyear.

Gas Lift
Although gas liftis not new to Anschutz, Merit has been tryingto extend its capabilities. Our first hurdle
regardinggas liftis obtainingadditionalliftgas capacity.We currentlyutilizesales gas for gas lift.Based
on our current compression, we are limited to 4 mmcfdof liftgas. In additionto increasing our gas lift
capability,Merit is exploring the idea of utilizingnitrogenfor gas lift.

With that being said, we currentlyhave seventeen wellscapable of being gas lifted. Due to our limited
liftgas capacity,onlysix (6) wells are currentlybeing gas lifted.

Additionally, Merit is working with several service companies to explore ways to gas liftfrom below the
packer. There are several wells at Anschutz that have one to two thousand feet of pay. As a result,
conventional gas liftmay or may not be effective. We have tried one method of gas liftingfrom below
the packer and the results are great. However, thismethod is not a "cure-all".Itwillonly work on select
wells. We willcontinue to look for wells capable of being lifted in thismanner. We are in the process of
identifying a candidate to test another method of gas liftingfrom below the packer. As soon as the well
is identified, the installation willbe performed.

While Merit is stillin the early phase of developing completiontechniques to adequately produce the
wells at Anschutz, we are making great progress. We have had to think"out-of-the-box"to come up
with creative ways to remove the water and increase the gas and are exhausting all resources to
improve production and reduce idle wellbores.

I have attached the February 13 letter as well as ourcurrent plans for the24 wells.

If you have any questions or require additional information, please contact me at (972) 628-1550 or
electronicallyat mike.mercer@meritenergy.com.

Sincerely,

Michael L. Mercer
Operations
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13727 Noel Road, Suite 500
Dallas, TX 75240
Ph: 972-701-8377 Fx: 972-960-1252

MER I T ENERGY COMP A NY www.meritenergy.com

Date: February 13, 2004

Subject Extended Shut-in wells in the Anschutz Ranch East Field

Dear Mr. Doucet:

In response to your letter dated January 22, 2004, I would like to submit the attached supporting documentation
regarding our extendedshut-in wells. Merit Energy Company purchased an operating interest in theAnschutz Ranch
East Unit from BP Production Company effective July 1, 2003, and has spent the last seven months evaluating the
production capability of all active and inactive wells in the field. This process has resulted in workovers thathave
reestablished production in several of these wells, and revealed future opportunities for all of the others. Here is a
quick synopsis of our plans for each well.

• ARE W20-06- Workover is planned to immediately reactive this well by rimning smaller tubing,and putting
the well on gas lift. Should be reactivated by mid year 2004.

• ARE W31-04- BP attempted a directional reentry of this wellbore in 2001, during which time the drill pipe
was inadvertently cemented in thehorizontal section of the wellbore. Merit is investigating methods to
effectively stimulate this wellbore and return it to production. Ifunable to do so, it will be plugged.

• ARE W36-10- This well will be the first test candidate for an experimental production method for artificial
lifting gas wells. An electric submersible pump will be run in this well in the next couple of months in an
attempt to reestablish production by removing large volumes of water from the formation. If this project is
successful it could lead to the reactivation of virtually every inactive well in the field. The project is
approved internally, and we are waiting on equipment and supplies before mobilizing a service rig.

• ARE W36-08- This well has been reactivated following a workover last fall. A sundry notice was filed and
approved by the Utah Oil and Gas Commission.

• ARE W21-04- Surface tubingpressure indicates this well may be capable of producing again. However
attempts to return this well to production with the current wellbore configuration have not been successful.
Merit plans to install smaller tubing and gas lift on this well. If that is unsuccessful, this well is also a
candidate for an electric submersible pump installation. If all attempts to reactivate the Nugget formation fail,
this well is a recompletion candidate in the Twin Creekformation.

• Champlin 372 C-1- This well is capable of producing for a few days at a time, but quickly loads up with
water and dies. Again, thiswell is a candidate for an electric submersible pump installation, or may be used
as a salt water disposal well if additional capacity is needed due to the ESP program.

• ARE W16-06- This well will have an electric submersible pump installed if the program is successful.
Otherwise it will be plugged.

• ARE WO1-12-This well will have an electric submersible pump installed if the program is successful. It is
also considered for an uphole recompletion.

• ARE W30-02- An attempt was made to return thiswell to production last fall, butwas unsuccessful dueto
high water production. Pending the success of the W36-10, this well will also have an electric submersible
pump installed.

• ARE W36-14- This weHwill have an electric submersible pump instaued if the program is successful. It is
also considered for an uphole recompletion.

• ARE W30-06- This well wiHhave an electric submersible pump installed if the program is successful. It is
also considered for an uphole recompletion.

• ARE W20-02- A workover has been approved internally to reactivate this well, and should begin in the next
few weeks A sundry notice was filed and approved by the Utah Oil and Gas Commission.

• ARE W30-13- This well will have an electric submersible pump installed if the program is successful. It is
also considered for an uphole recompletion.

• ARE W19-16- This well will havean electric submersible pump installed if theprogram is successful. It is
also considered for an uphole recompletion.
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• ARE W20-04- This wen-will have an electric submersible pump installell If the program is successful. It isalsoconsidered for an uphole recompletion.
• ARE W31-12- An attempt was madeto reactivate this well in late 2003, but was unsuccessful. A sundry

notice was filed and approved by the Utah Oil and Gas Commission. An uphole recompletion in the Twin
Creek formation is planned and will be completed in the next few months.

• ARE WO1-04-This well will have an electric submersible pump installed if theprogramis successful. It is
also considered for an uphole recompletion.

• ARE W11-01- This well will havean electric submersible pump installed if theprogram is successful.
Otherwise it will beplugged.

• ARE W20-03- This well will have an electric submersible pump installed if the program is successful. It is
also considered for an uphole recompletion.

• ARE W16-14- This well will have an electric submersible pump installed if the program is successful. It is
also considered for salt water disposal well if additionalcapacity is needed.

• ARE W16-12- This well will have an electric submersible pump installed if theprogram is successful. It is
also considered for salt water disposal weß if additional capacity is needed.

• Champlin 387 B-1A- Merit Energy is in theprocess of obtaining records from BP for this well. Once
historical information is obtained, we will evaluate all feasible methods to return this well to producing status.
Otherwise it will be plugged.

• ARE W17-16- This well will have an electric submersible pump installed if the program is successful. It is
also considered for salt water disposal well if additional capacity is needed.

• ARE E21-14- This well was returned to producing status on 12/19/03.

In addition to this information, I have enclosed pressure data for au weHs,and a wellbore schematic for aHwells
except the Champlin 387 B-lA. The static bottom hole pressures and static fluid levels were couected in September
2003 with bottom hole gauges. If you need any further information, please contact me at 972-628-1651 or
electronically at lance.taylor meritenergy.com.

Operations Engineer

Cc: Rusty Ginnetti
Arlene Valliquette
Dennis Longwell

Attachments: (1) page of pressure data, (23) weHboreschematics



Well Name API Lease Type Years inactive
1 ARE W20-06 43-043-30159 Fee 1 Year 2 Months
2 ARE W31-04E 43-043-30165 Fee 1 Year 3 Months
3 ARE W36-10 43-043-30227 Fee 1 Year 3 Months
4 ARE W36-08 43-043-30167 Fee 1 Year 7 Months

Wells with returned Sur dry Notices and attached equirement sheet dated November 19, 2003
1 ARE W21-04 43-043-30135 Fee 1 Year 10 Months
2 Champlin 372 Amoco C1 43-043-30143 Fee 1 Year 11 Months
3 ARE W16-06 43-043-30138 Fee 1 Year 11 Months
4 ARE WO1-12 43-043-30271 Fee 2 Years 4 Months
5 ARE W30-02 43-043-30218 Fee 3 Years 2 Months
6 ARE W36-14 43-043-30255 Fee 4 Years 5 Months
7 ARE W30-06 43-043-30273 Fee 5 Years 4 Months
8 ARE W20-02 43-043-30228 Fee 5 Years 4 Months
9 ARE W30-13 43-043-30279 Fee 5 Years 6 Months
10 ARE W19-16 43-043-30204 Fee 5 Years 8 Months
11 ARE W20-4 43-043-30238 Fee 6 Years 3 Months
12 ARE W31-12 43-043-30190 Fee 7 Years 3 Months
13 ARE WO1-04 43-043-30270 Fee 7 Years 4 Months
14 ARE W11-01 43-043-30277 Fee 7 Years 4 Months
15 ARE W20-03 43-043-30291 Fee 8 Years 1 Month
16 ARE W16-14 43-043-30096 Fee 8 Years 1 Month
17 ARE 16-12 43-043-30231 Fee 8 Years 3 Months
18 Champlin 387 B1A 43-043-30168 Fee 8 Years 6 Months
19 ARE W17-16 43-043-30176 Fee 8 Years 7 Months
20 ARE E21-14 43-043-30130 Fee 10 Years 8 Months
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UTAH DOGM - SI WELL LIST

• ARE W20-06 - worked over in 2004, selectively swab tested individual zones. Installed
gas lift (GL) equipment. Currently intermittently producing when liftqas is available.

• ARE W31-04 -.no immediate plans, willevaluate for reactivation.
• ARE W36-10 - installed ESP. The well is producing.
• ARE W36-08 - the well was reactivated in the fall of 2003. A capillarystring was installed

in September 2004. The well is producing.
• ARE W21-04 - worked over in 2004. Installed GL equipment. Currently intermittently

producing when lift qas is available.
CHAMPLIN 372 C1 - swabbed in October 2004. Swab results were encouraging. There
are no production facilities or flowlines in place. We are in the process of purchasing a
gas testingunit. Once the unit is in our possession, we will flow test this well and evaluate
the economics of installing surface facilities.

• ARE W16-06 - swabbed in November 2004. Currently sizing ESP and reconditioning
generator for test. Anticipate having ESP running by end of the year.

• ARE WO1-12 - no immediate plans, willevaluate for reactivation.
• ARE W30-02 - plan to install ESP in 2005 for test.
• ARE W36-14 - plan to install ESP in 2005 for test.
• ARE W30-06 - plan to install ESP in 2005 for test.
• ARE W20-02 - worked over in 2004. Installed GL equipment. Currently intermittently

producing when liftqas is available.

• ARE W30-13 - plan to install ESP in 2005 for test.
• ARE W19-16 - no immediate plans, willevaluate for reactivation.

• ARE W20-04 - no immediate plans, willevaluate for reactivation.

ARE W31-12 - plan to test the Nugget, if unsuccessful, will attempt a Twin Creek
completion.

• ARE WO1-04 - no immediate plans, willevaluate for reactivation.
• ARE W11-01 - no immediate plans, willevaluate for reactivation.

• ARE W20-03- no immediate plans, willevaluate for reactivation.

• ARE W16-14 - no immediate plans, willevaluate for reactivation.

• ARE W16-12 - no immediate plans, willevaluate for reactivation.

• CHAMPLIN 387 B1A - no immediate plans, will evaluate for reactivation.

• ARE W17-16 - no immediate plans, willevaluate for reactivation.

• ARE E21-14 - the well was reactivated in December 2003. The well is
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Governor

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah April 8, 2005

Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAEL R. STYLER Merit Energy Company
Executive Director

Attn: Michael L. Mercer
Division of 13727 Noel Road, Suite 500

Oil, Gas & Mining Dallas, Texas 75240

MARY ANN WRIGHT
Acting Division Director

Re: Approval for Extension of Shut-in or Temporarily Abandoned Status for Wells
on Fee or State Leases

Dear Mr. Mercer:

The Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Division") is in receipt of your
letters dated November 10, 2004 (received by the Division on November 12, 2004)
and January 7, 2005 (received by the Division on January 10, 2005) in regards to the
twenty-four (24) shut-in wells operated by Merit Energy Company ("Merit"). The
Division understands that six of these wells were put back into production in 2004.
Merit's original plan was to return all twenty-four wells to production in 2004.
Because of power restrictions, etc., Merit was unable to achieve that target. It is now
the Division's understanding that Merit plans to return seven more wells to production
in 2005 by installing an ESP. The Division understands that Merit is also
investigating other methods to assist in lifting the water (e.g. capillary strings).
Depending on the success of the wells with ESP's installed, the wells currently on Gas
Lift, and the success of the other methods, the remaining 11 wells will either be
plugged or put into production.

Based on the submitted information and plan of action, the Division approves
your request for extended SI/TA for the eighteen (18) remaining SI/TA wells (see
attachment A) until January 1, 2006. The operator should continue to monitor the
wells by documenting pressures and fluid levels on a periodic basis. Any significant
change in pressure or fluid level should be reported to the Division immediately.
Remedial action may be necessary.

In addition to the twenty-four wells mentioned above, Merit also has one new
well for 2005 that requires approval for extended SI/TA. The well is the ARE W30-
14 (API # 43-043-30185). Our records indicate that this well has been SI/TA since
February of 2003. Merit must submit their future plans for this well and information
that demonstrates the well has integrity and is not a risk to public health and safety or
the environment (R649-3-36-1.1 to 1.3).

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, SaltLake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801)538-5340 •facsimile (801) 359-3940 •TTY (801) 538-7458

JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
Governor

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah April 8, 2005

Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAEL R. STYLER Merit Energy Company
Executive Director

Attn: Michael L. Mercer
Division of 13727 Noel Road, Suite 500

Oil, Gas & Mining Dallas, Texas 75240

MARY ANN WRIGHT
Acting Division Director

Re: Approval for Extension of Shut-in or Temporarily Abandoned Status for Wells
on Fee or State Leases

Dear Mr. Mercer:

The Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Division") is in receipt of your
letters dated November 10, 2004 (received by the Division on November 12, 2004)
and January 7, 2005 (received by the Division on January 10, 2005) in regards to the
twenty-four (24) shut-in wells operated by Merit Energy Company ("Merit"). The
Division understands that six of these wells were put back into production in 2004.
Merit's original plan was to return all twenty-four wells to production in 2004.
Because of power restrictions, etc., Merit was unable to achieve that target. It is now
the Division's understanding that Merit plans to return seven more wells to production
in 2005 by installing an ESP. The Division understands that Merit is also
investigating other methods to assist in lifting the water (e.g. capillary strings).
Depending on the success of the wells with ESP's installed, the wells currently on Gas
Lift, and the success of the other methods, the remaining 11 wells will either be
plugged or put into production.

Based on the submitted information and plan of action, the Division approves
your request for extended SI/TA for the eighteen (18) remaining SI/TA wells (see
attachment A) until January 1, 2006. The operator should continue to monitor the
wells by documenting pressures and fluid levels on a periodic basis. Any significant
change in pressure or fluid level should be reported to the Division immediately.
Remedial action may be necessary.

In addition to the twenty-four wells mentioned above, Merit also has one new
well for 2005 that requires approval for extended SI/TA. The well is the ARE W30-
14 (API # 43-043-30185). Our records indicate that this well has been SI/TA since
February of 2003. Merit must submit their future plans for this well and information
that demonstrates the well has integrity and is not a risk to public health and safety or
the environment (R649-3-36-1.1 to 1.3).

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, SaltLake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801)538-5340 •facsimile (801) 359-3940 •TTY (801) 538-7458
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Merit Energy Company
April 8, 2005

The required information should be submitted to the Division within 30 days
of the date of this letter or further actions may be initiated. If you have any questions
or need additional assistance in regards to the above matters please contact me at
(801) 538-5281.

Sincerel

Dustin oucet
Petroleum Engineer

DKD:jc
Attachment
cc: Well
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ATTACHMENT A

Well Name API Lease Type Years Inactive
1 ARE W31-04E 43-043-30165 Fee 2 Year 3 Months
2 Champlin 372 Amoco C 1 43-043-30143 Fee 2 Year 11 Months
3 ARE W16-06 43-043-30138 Fee 2 Year 11 Months
4 ARE WO1-12 43-043-30271 Fee 3 Years 4 Months
5 ARE W30-02 43-043-30218 Fee 4 Years 2 Months
6 ARE W36-14 43-043-30255 Fee 5Years 5 Months
7 ARE W30-06 43-043-30273 Fee 6 Years 4 Months
8 ARE W30-13 43-043-30279 Fee 6 Years 6 Months
9 ARE W19-16 43-043-30204 Fee 6 Years 8 Months
10 ARE W20-04 43-043-30238 Fee 7 Years 3 Months
11 ARE W31-12 43-043-30190 Fee 8 Years 3 Months
12 ARE WO1-04 43-043-30270 Fee 8 Years 4 Months
13 ARE W11-01 43-043-30277 Fee 8 Years 4 Months
14 ARE W20-03 43-043-30291 Fee 9 Years 1 Month
15 ARE W16-14 43-043-30096 Fee 9 Years 1 Month
16 ARE W16-12 43-043-30231 Fee 9 Years 3 Months
17 Champlin 387 B1A 43-043-30168 Fee 9 Years 6 Months
18 ARE W17-16 43-043-30176 Fee 9 Years 7
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State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER
ExecutiveDirector

JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
ÛÎVision of Oil, Gas and Mining

Governor JOHN R. BAZA

GARY R. HERBERT
Division Director

Lieutenant Governor

August 26, 2008

CERTIFIED MAIL NO. 7004 2510 0004 1824 6053

Mr. Michael Mercer
Merit Energy Company
13727 Noel Road, Suite 500
Dallas, TX 75240

Re: Third Notice of Extended Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned Well Requirements for
Fee or State Leases

Dear Mr. Mercer:

As of July 2008, Merit Energy Company has fifteen (15) Fee Lease Wells that are in non-
compliance with the requirements for extended shut-in or temporarily abandoned (SI/TA) status
(see attachment A). All wells SI/TA beyond twelve (12) consecutive months require the filing of
a Sundry Notice in accordance with R649-3-36-1 for Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
("Division") approval. Wells with five (5) years non-activity or non-productivity shall be
plugged, unless the Division grants approval for extended shut-in time upon a showing of good
cause by the operator (R649-3-36-1.3.3).

On January 22, 2004 the Division notified Merit by certified mail 24 wells were on the
SI/TA list. Merit responded by letters of February 13, 2004, November 10, 2004, and January 5,
2005, with evaluation plans for each of the 24 wells. By the time an extension of SI/TA status
was granted to Merit by the Division on April 8, 2005, six of the original 24 wells had been
returned to production.

To date, 10 of the original 24 wells remain as SI/TA. Two wells were producing briefly
in 2005 but have since returned to SI/TA status. These wells are listed as number 8 and number
10 on Attachment A. Two additional wells (ARE W36-08 API# 43-043-30167 & ARE 29-04
ST1 API# 43-043-30129) were producing briefly for 3 months in 2007, but are now showing as
SI, and will soon be added to this list.

Five (5) new wells have been added to the current list. These are the wells numbered 11
through 15 on Attachment A

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone(801) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 •TTY (801) 538-7458 • www.ogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS &
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August 26, 2008
Mr. Mercer

Please submit your plans to produce or plug these wells to DOGM within 30 days of this
notice or a Notice of Violation (NOV) will be issued.

For extended SI/TA consideration of each well on the SI/TA list, the operator shall
provide the Division with the following:

1. Reasons for SI/TA of the well (R649-3-36-1.1).
2. The length of time the well is expected to be SI/TA (R649-3-36-1.2), and
3. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, showing the well has integrity,

meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition, static fluid level, pressure,
existence/or absence of Underground Sources of Drinking Water, and other
factors do not make the well a risk to public health and safety or the environment
(R649-3-36-1.3).

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity and may help
qualify your well for extended SI/TA. Note: As of July 1, 2003, wells in violation of the SI/TA
rule R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-1-4.2, 4.3).

1. Wellbore diagram, and
2. Copy of recent casing pressure test, and
3. Current pressures on the wellbore (tubing pressure, casing pressure, and

casing/casing annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity, and
4. Fluid level in the well bore, and
5. An explanation of how the submitted information proves integrity.

If the required information is not received within 30 days of the date of this notice, further
actions will be initiated. If you have any questions concerning thismatter, please contact me at
(801) 538-5281.

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

JP/js
Attachment
ec: Well File

Operator Compliance
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ATTACHMENT A

Well Name API Lease Type Years Inactive
1 CHAMPLIN 387 B1A 43-043-30168 Fee 14 Years 3 Months
2 ARE W16-12 43-043-30231 Fee 12 Years 11 Months
3 ARE W16-14 43-043-30096 Fee 12 Years 9 Months
4 ARE W31-12 43-043-30190 Fee 11 Years 11 Months
5 ARE W31-04E 43-043-30165 Fee 5 Years 10 Months
6 CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1 43-043-30143 Fee 6 Years 8 Months
7 ARE W16-06 43-043-30138 Fee 3 Years 1 Month
8 ARE W20-06 43-043-30159 Fee 2 Years 10 Months
9 ARE W17-16 43-043-30176 Fee 1 Year 9 Months
10 ARE W20-02 43-043-30228 Fee 2 Years O Months

Newly Added
11 ARE W20-12 43-043-30220 Fee 2 Years 3 Months
12 ARE W31-06 43-043-30217 Fee 1 Year 5 Months
13 ARE W31-08 43-043-30164 Fee 1 Year 6 Months
14 ARE W36-16 43-043-30157 Fee 1 Year 3 Months
15 ARE E28-06 43-043-30226 Fee 1 Year 1
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State of Utah
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v. ExecutiveDirector
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Governor JOHN R. BAZA
Division Director

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

January 21, 2009

43 D43 5 0 43
Mr. Nicholas Tunnell g|| SQL kly.£)
Merit Energy Company
13727 Noel Road, Suite 500
Dallas, TX 75240

Subject: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned Well Requirements for Fee or State
Leases dated August 26, 2008.

Dear Mr. Tunnell:

The Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (the Division) is in receipt of your letter dated
October 17, 2008 in regards to the fifteen (15) shut-in or temporarily abandoned (SI/TA) Fee
Lease Wells (Attachment A) operated by Merit Energy Company (Merit).

The Division does not object to the proposed work on the said wells. Several of the
wells listed look as though they may have integrity. However, due to insufficient evidence the
Division is unable to grant extended SI/TA status for these wells. Not enough data was received
per R649-3-36 providing proof of integrity or lengths of time wells are expected to be shut-in
The Divisions preferred method of demonstrating well integrity is to perform an MIT. Please
submit the necessary information to bring these wells back into compliance. Please note,
approval will be necessary prior to continuing with the planned work for these wells.

Please submit an individual sundry for each well along with required information to
help expedite approval and documentation processes. If the required information is not received
within 30 days of the date of this notice, further actions may be initiated. If you have any
questions concerning this matter, please contact me at (801) 538-5281.

incerely,

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

DKD/JP/js
Enclosure
ec: Well FileS UTAH

Compliance File DNRN:\O&G Reviewed Docs\ChronFile\PetroleumEngineer\SITA

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
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State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OFNATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER
v. ExecutiveDirector

JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
Division of Oil Gas and Mining

Governor JOHN R. BAZA
Division Director

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

January 21, 2009

43 D43 5 0 43
Mr. Nicholas Tunnell g|| SQL kly.£)
Merit Energy Company
13727 Noel Road, Suite 500
Dallas, TX 75240

Subject: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned Well Requirements for Fee or State
Leases dated August 26, 2008.

Dear Mr. Tunnell:

The Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (the Division) is in receipt of your letter dated
October 17, 2008 in regards to the fifteen (15) shut-in or temporarily abandoned (SI/TA) Fee
Lease Wells (Attachment A) operated by Merit Energy Company (Merit).

The Division does not object to the proposed work on the said wells. Several of the
wells listed look as though they may have integrity. However, due to insufficient evidence the
Division is unable to grant extended SI/TA status for these wells. Not enough data was received
per R649-3-36 providing proof of integrity or lengths of time wells are expected to be shut-in
The Divisions preferred method of demonstrating well integrity is to perform an MIT. Please
submit the necessary information to bring these wells back into compliance. Please note,
approval will be necessary prior to continuing with the planned work for these wells.

Please submit an individual sundry for each well along with required information to
help expedite approval and documentation processes. If the required information is not received
within 30 days of the date of this notice, further actions may be initiated. If you have any
questions concerning this matter, please contact me at (801) 538-5281.

incerely,

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

DKD/JP/js
Enclosure
ec: Well FileS UTAH

Compliance File DNRN:\O&G Reviewed Docs\ChronFile\PetroleumEngineer\SITA

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • wwwogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS &



ATTACHMENT A

Well Name API Lease Type Years Inactive
1 CHAMPLlN 387 B1A 43-043-30168 Fee 14 Years 3 Months
2 ARE W16-12 43-043-30231 Fee 12 Years 11 Months
3 ARE W16-14 43-043-30096 Fee 12 Years 9 Months
4 ARE W31-12 43-043-30190 Fee 11 Years 11 Months
5 ARE W31-04E 43-043-30165 Fee 5 Years 10 Months
6 CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1 43-043-30143 Fee 6 Years 8 Months
7 ARE W16-06 43-043-30138 Fee 3 Years i Month
8 ARE W20-06 43-043-30159 Fee 2 Years 10 Months
9 ARE W17-16 43-043-30176 Fee 1 Year 9 Months
10 ARE W20-02 43-043-30228 Fee 2 Years 0 Months
11 ARE W20-12 43-043-30220 Fee 2 Years 3 Months
12 ARE W31-06 43-043-30217 Fee 1 Year 5 Months
13 ARE W31-08 43-043-30164 Fee 1 Year 6 Months
14 ARE W36-16 43-043-30157 Fee 1 Year 3 Months
15 ARE E28-06 43-043-30226 Fee 1 Year 1
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MERIT ENERGY COMPANY
13727 Noel Road - Suite 500 - Dallas, Texas 75240
Ph 972.701.8377 - Fx 972.960.1252 - www.meritenergy.com

October 17, 2008

State of Utah -- Department of Natural ResourcesDivisionofOil, Gas, &Mining
Atto: Mr. Dustin Doucet
PO Box 145801
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Dear Mr.Doucet:

In response to your letter dated August 26, 2008, I would like to submit the attached supportingdocumentation regarding our extended shut-inwells.
Enclosed, please find a summarysheet withMerit Energy Company's future plans for each of the wellslisted in your letter, a sheet withexplanations and supporting data showing each well'sintegrity, as wellas wellborediagrams for thesubject wells.
If you have any questions or wish to discuss thisfurther, please contact me at (972) 628-1084 orelectronically at nick.tunnell@meritenergy.com.
Sincerely,

Nicholas R. Tunnell
Operations Engineer
MeritEnergy
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UTAH DOGM - SI WELL LIST

• CHAMPLIN 387 B1A- Plan to P&A well in March2009 due to availabilityof rig. I I

• ARE W16-12 - Plan to run slicklineto verify PBTD, swab test Nugget to evaluate
potential, if unsuccessful, willattempt a Twin Creek completion.

ARE W16-14 - Plan to run slickline to verify PBTD, swab test Nugget to evaluate
potential, if unsuccessful, will attempt a Twin Creek completion.
ARE W31-12 - Plan to swab test the Nugget, if unsuccessful, will attempt a Twin Creek
completion.
ARE W31-04 - Plan to swab test Nugget, if unsuccessful, willattempt a Twin Creek
completion.

CHAMPLIN 372 C1 - Swabbed in October 2004. Swab results were encouraging. There l
are no production facilities or flowlines in place. Merit is in the process of tryingto buy a NT
flowline in the area to tie into, at which point Merit willattempt to react vate the ell in the
Nugget or attempt a Twin Creek completion, 4 t<-- P^ * B"U' 4

• ARE W16-06 - Ran ESP in the well, unsuccessful due to water volumes, willattempt a 7000
Twin Creek completion. ( 56r o /

2co¾ 0 ARE W20-06 - Tested upper zone of Nugget in 2004, unsuccessful, plan to drill out
cement & CIBP and produce lower zone.

vi ARE W17-16 - SI due to availability of gas liftgas, gas is available, plan to kick well off
with gas lift, if unsuccessful, willattempt a Twin Creek completion.

yee • ARE W20-02 - Installed conventional gas lift, unsuccessful, plan to run survey to
evaluate reverse gas lift potential, if unsuccessful, willattempt Twin Creek completion.

ob • ARE W20-12 - Installed conventional gas lift, cycling gas, plan to run survey to evaluate
reverse gas lift potential, if unsuccessful, willattempt Twin Creek completion.

4 o A • ARE W31-06 - Plan to install reverse gas liftto reactivate well, if unsuccessful, will (og
attempt Twin Creek completion. Es 5

NP • ARE W31-08 - Rig on location, squeezed off casing leak, drilling out cement, plan to
install reverse gas lift to reactivate well, if unsuccessful, willattempt Twin Creek e ,
completion.

• ARE W36-16 - Coil tubing gas liftdesign in the well, plan to pull the coil tubing and instal 2
reverse gas lift to reactivate well, if unsuccessful, willattempt Twin Creek completion.

• ARE W28-06 - Collapsed casing at 12,678', will attempt a Twin Creek completion. e é
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completion.

CHAMPLIN 372 C1 - Swabbed in October 2004. Swab results were encouraging. There l
are no production facilities or flowlines in place. Merit is in the process of tryingto buy a NT
flowline in the area to tie into, at which point Merit willattempt to react vate the ell in the
Nugget or attempt a Twin Creek completion, 4 t<-- P^ * B"U' 4

• ARE W16-06 - Ran ESP in the well, unsuccessful due to water volumes, willattempt a 7000
Twin Creek completion. ( 56r o /

2co¾ 0 ARE W20-06 - Tested upper zone of Nugget in 2004, unsuccessful, plan to drill out
cement & CIBP and produce lower zone.

vi ARE W17-16 - SI due to availability of gas liftgas, gas is available, plan to kick well off
with gas lift, if unsuccessful, willattempt a Twin Creek completion.

yee • ARE W20-02 - Installed conventional gas lift, unsuccessful, plan to run survey to
evaluate reverse gas lift potential, if unsuccessful, willattempt Twin Creek completion.

ob • ARE W20-12 - Installed conventional gas lift, cycling gas, plan to run survey to evaluate
reverse gas lift potential, if unsuccessful, willattempt Twin Creek completion.

4 o A • ARE W31-06 - Plan to install reverse gas liftto reactivate well, if unsuccessful, will (og
attempt Twin Creek completion. Es 5

NP • ARE W31-08 - Rig on location, squeezed off casing leak, drilling out cement, plan to
install reverse gas lift to reactivate well, if unsuccessful, willattempt Twin Creek e ,
completion.

• ARE W36-16 - Coil tubing gas liftdesign in the well, plan to pull the coil tubing and instal 2
reverse gas lift to reactivate well, if unsuccessful, willattempt Twin Creek completion.

• ARE W28-06 - Collapsed casing at 12,678', will attempt a Twin Creek completion. e é



UTAH DOGM - SI WELL LIST

Wells to be Reactivated in 2009
• ARE W16-12

o Packer at 10,304
o Top of cement(TOC)at 10,100 (9-5/8" casing) Zoos oc
o Tubing Pressure 50# em T o o
o Casing Pressure 0# my yo o
o The packer is located below the TOC. The tubingpressure and casing pressure are ex>S oc

different. Therefore, the casing and tubingare not in communication and the groundwaters are protected.
. , A• ARE W16-14

o Packer (PBR)at 10,500 ce é o RA
o Top of cement (TOC) at 9,650 (9-5/8" casing) 2mí o rvA
o Tubing Pressure 1650# 4 mz id
o Casing Pressure 850# 3 * O
o The tubingis tied into the 4-1/2" liner witha PBR at 10,500. This is below the TOC for th Ý04009-5/8" casing string. The tubingpressure and casing pressure are different. Therefore,thecasing and tubingare not in communication and the ground waters are protected y W4• ARE W31-12
o Packer at none NAo Top of cement (TOC)at 10,700 syo Casing Pressure 100#

,¤¤3 4o Fluid Level 1000' from Surface
o There is not a packer or tubingin thiswell. The static fluid level is 1000' from surface.There is a 13-3/8" casing string set at 2846', a 9-5/8" casing string set at 10272', and a 7"tie-backcasing string set at 9919'. These three casing strings are protecting the groundwaters.

• ARE W31-04
2eo 2o Packer at 14,000 eaGo Top of cement (TOC) at 11,900 2cos im 36

o Tubing Pressure 1000# to 4 nao
o Casing Pressure 0# -3 o
o This well is a horizontal sidetrack. The primarycement job on the original production

casing had a TOC at 11,900. The kick-off point for the horizontal leg is below thisdepth.
Additionally, the drill string was cemented in the horizontal section with the TOCestimated to be between 13126 and 13310. Based on the fact that the tubingand casingpressures are different, the twoare not in communication and therefore,the groundwaters are protected.

• CHAMPLIN372 C1
o Packer at 8,320 (MD) 6,648 (TVD)
o Top of cement (TOC) at 4,906
o Tubing Pressure 0#

2c"3 ,, cao Casing Pressure 0#
o The 4-1/2" liner is cemented in place at 5090 (below the TOC).

ye; pg iv 4
• ARE W16-06

><o NA N Aro Packer at none
µ4o Top of cement (TOC) at 12,640

o Casing Pressure 0#
o When Merit set a packer in October 2004, we pressure tested the annulus to 500 psi andit held. Therefore, the casing has integrity and the ground waters are protected.

• ARE W20-06
o Packer at 12,858'
o Top of cement (TOC) at 9,650' (9-5/8" casing) 2cca é no we
o Tubing Pressure 0#
o Casing Pressure 0#
o When Merit set the packer in June 2004, we pressure tested the annulus to 500 ps! and Tiheld. There is a 13-3/8" casing string set at 5411', a 9-5/8" casing string set at 11330',
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UTAHDOGM - SI WELL LIST

and a 7" tie-backcasing string set at 10079'. These threecasing strings are protectingthe ground waters.
• ARE W17-16 2 f(W Göd

o Packer 13,747' G Q t i os
o Top of cement (TOC) at 10,371' (7-5/8" casing) of C Uo Tubing Pressure 78# om
o Casing Pressure 53#
o There is a 13-3/8" casing string set at 2526', a 9-5/8" casing string set at 10701', and a 7"tie-backcasing string set at 10237'. These threecasing strings are protecting the groundwaters.

qq Rd
• ARE W20-02

2e ¡ y
12°

o Packerat 12,646' gooy g,o . ¿ydo Top of cement (TOC) at 8,910' (7" casing) 2o 6 4 C) f°o Tubing Pressure 384# gog c> 0o Casing Pressure 310# M a 7% Oo There is a 13-3/8" casing string set at 5140', a 9-5/8" casing string set at 10934', and a 7"casing string set at 13928'. These threecasing strings are protecting the ground waters.
• ARE W20-12 zoo+ 93 lox

o Packer at 12,863'
o Top of cement (TOC) at 10,372' (9-5/8" casing)
o Tubing Pressure 912#
o Casing Pressure 930#
o There is a î 3-3/8" casing string set at 5362', a 9-5/8" casing string set at 11245', and a 7"tie-backcasing string set at 10109'. These threecasing strings are protecting the groundwaters.

gog e to A• ARE W31-06
Souta 270 AAo Packer at 10284' zof a µ>o Top of cement (TOC) at 9996' (7" casing) 2-* 4 no 444o Tubing Pressure 0# 2°°S S' emo Casing Pressure 0#

o There is a 13-3/8" casing string set at 2301', a 9-5/8" casing string set at 10689', and a 7"casing string set at 14033'. These threecasing strings are protecting the ground waters.
• ARE W36-16

~2001 i à Qo Packer (PBR) at 10,680 Zoo é, e oo Top of cement (TOC) at 10,172 (7" casing) 22 y eo Tubing Pressure 1357# a 4 tro oo Casing Pressure 0# L3 tyo o
o The packer is located below the TOC, The tubing pressure and casing pressure aredifferent. Therefore, the casing and tubingare not in communication and the groundwaters are protected· 2co N A

• ARE E28-06
goo y Co Packer at none goog gyo Top of cement (TOC) at 11,900' (7" casing) 2co 3 2co Tðo Tubing Pressure 0#

o Casing Pressure 0#
o There is a 13-3/8" casing string set at 3988', a 9-5/8" casing string set at 12990', and a 7"tie-backcasing string set at 12313'. These threecasing strings are protecting the groundwaters.
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WELLNAME: ARE W16-12 FIELD: ANSCHUfZ RANCH EAST
QTR QTR: SEC: 16 TWN: 4N RNG: SE
COUNTY: SUMMIT ST: UT SPUD DATE:
KB: 7387 GL: 7360 TD: 15112 PBTD: 13395
LASTUPDATED: , 10/11/04 BY: MIKE MERCER

CASING DETAILS
PURPOSE SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH
SURFACE 13-3/8" 61-72# S-80, HC-95 4862'
INTERMEDIATE 9-5/8", 9-7/8" 53.5-62.8# S-95, S-105 11757'
INTERMEDIATE 7-5/8" 45.3# P-110 F/10852-12102
PRODUCTION 5" 17.93# P-110 F/10473-15105

TUBING DETAILS
DESCRIPTION SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEFTH
KB 27.00
XO 3-1/2" X 2-7/8"
229 JTS 2-7/8" 8.7# PH-6
xo
89 JTS 2-7/8" 8.6# L-80
R-NIPPLE 2.215" 10,272.00
1 JT 2-7/8" 8.7# L-80
BAKER51A2 10,304.00
XO 2-7/8" X 2-3/8"
86 JTS 2-3/8" 4.7# 3-55 CS-HYDR
XN NIPPLE 1.875" W/ 1.791 12,981.00
1 JT 2-3/8" 4.7# J-55 CS-HYDR
XO
WL REENTRY 13,015.00
Based on 06/02/)5 WBS

WELL HISTORY:
Apr-85 Sqz Z2, perf Z1 & Z2
Aug-86 Sqz upper Z1
Sep-86 Reperf lower Z1 & Z2
Jul-87 PLT run
JuW89 Opened 9-5/8" casing
Sep-91 Re-sqzd and mechanically isolated upper Z1
May-95 Downsized f/ 3-1/2" to 2-3/8" tubing.Reperf Z1 & upper Z2

TOC @ 12890'

NUGGET PERFS
13130-156, 13166-181
13194-232, 13240-244

NUGGET PERFS
13252-264, 13275-313
13325-344, 13352-376

CICR @13420' w/ 25' cmt on top
SQZD PERFS
13394-474, 13480-520
13552-648, 13684-728
13738-750

O DVTOOL. 13-3/8" @

WELLNAME: ARE W16-12 FIELD: ANSCHUfZ RANCH EAST
QTR QTR: SEC: 16 TWN: 4N RNG: SE
COUNTY: SUMMIT ST: UT SPUD DATE:
KB: 7387 GL: 7360 TD: 15112 PBTD: 13395
LASTUPDATED: , 10/11/04 BY: MIKE MERCER
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WELLNAME: ARE W16-14 FIELD: ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST
QTR QTR: SEC: 16 TWN: 4N RNG: 8E
COUNTY: SUMMIT ST: UT SPUD DATE:
KB: 7324 GL: 7305 TD: 14050 PBTD: 13516
LASTUPDATED: QMO8K0m BY: MIKE MERCER

CASING DETAILS
PURPOSE SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH
SURFACE 13-3/8" 61-68# 2040'
INTERMEDIATE 9-5/8", 9-7/8" 40-62.8# 11091'
INTERMEDIATE 7-5/8" 39# F/10331-11310
PRODUCHON 4-1/2" 13.5# SS-95, P-110 F/10500-14045
PRODUCTION 7" 23-29# F/0-10331

TUBING DETAILS
DESCRIPTION SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH
KB 19.00
1 JT 3-1/2" 12.7# N-80Vam 50.24
PUP JT 3-1/2" 12.7# N-80Vam 56.19
PUP JT 3-1/2" 12.7# N-80Vam 66.27
XO 3-1/2" X 4-1/2" 67.12
323 JTS 4-1/2" 12.7# N-80 Hydril 10,493.23
XO 4-1/2" X 3-1/2" 10,494.00
Seal Assembly 10,511.20

Based on 04/07/35 Pulling Report

Baker Model A Simplex Hangar & Tie back sleeve

Size 80-40 Model G-22 Locator Seal Assembly. Landed w/ 6' out, 11' in
30,000# to pull out of PBR

WELL HIETORY:
PBR @ 10500'

TOC @ 11570'

NUGGET PERFS
12816-864, 12890-990
13016-076, 13100-180
13202-250, 13332-376
13400-464, 13500-515
PBTD 13516 (Fill)
CIBP @ 13630
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Seal Assembly 10,511.20
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ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST UNIT W31-12
Summit County, Utah

Location: 640' FWL & 1778' FNL Sec 31-T4N-R8E
Elevation: 7870' GLI 7890' KB

Last Updated by LLT2/12/2004

WELL HISTORY & NOTES13-3/8" Surface Casing @2846' 2/82 Champlin 458E-3 Spud by Amoco61# J-55 STC (85') 10/27/82 TD @14,418'48# H-40 STC (1112') 11/30/82 Complete @Zone 3 Producer54.5# K-55 STC (826') '
Perf 14,210-70' @4 spf & 90° phasing61#J-55 STC (845') Acidize w/6,255g 7.5% in 3 wash stagesCmtd w/ 3500 sxs 13.2 ppg 50/50 poz & Perf 13900-56' @4 spf & 90° phasing500 sxs 15.8 ppg class "G" Acidize w/ 5,250g 7.5% & 250# BAF

Set CIBP above all perts
Production Tubing removed 1/6/04 Perf 13042-578(OA) @4 spf &90° phasing

Acidize wl 22,000g 7.5% & 1500# BAF
5/13/82 Squeeze Zone 3 and Reperf7" Production Casing into Tie Back @ 9,919'

Sqz wl totalof 500sx in 3 tries under CICR29# N-80 LTC (86')
23# SOO-95 LTC (5423') Drillout all to 14,370'

23# S-95 LTC(513') TCP perf 13872-14326 OA @6 spf & 60°
26# N-80 LTC (3303') 10/11/89 Add Zone 2 Perfs
29# N-80 LTC (504') TCP perf 13022-850 OA @6 spf & 60°

Cmtd w/ 200 sxs 15.8 ppg class "G" 12/12/89 Acidize AII
Pump 3,000g 15% HCL

4/20/90 Lost spinner tool @14,000'
11/93 convert to injector9-5/8"x4-1/2" TlW hydr hanger @9,92T

7/16/96 Attempted water shut-off4" ID TlW PBR @9,937
Dump 10,180# 20/40 sand &60' cmt (tag @

Missing Re
rt2 L

t @12,53T9-5/8" intermediate Casing 10,272' 12/22/00 Pull tbg and clean out53.5#N-80 LTC (83') Clean out cmt/sand & CIBP down to cmt @43.5# N-80 LTC (520')
13,266'. No tbg in well.40# N-80 LTC (3608')

1/10/01 Run new 3-1/2" tbg43.5# N-80 LTC (1606')
47# N-80 LTC (2204') Caliper shows good csg/liner above 10,318

53.5# N-80 LTC (2191') 11/13/03 Install 2-3/8" tbg
Cmtd w/ 500 sxs 14.2 ppg 50/50 poz & 300 sxs 15.8 Set CIBP @ 13,202' w/ 10' cmt. TCP perf

ppg class "G" 12,854-94' @4 spf. Stimulate entire
Toc Nugget interval w/ propellant sleeves.

Unable to swab down. Suspect cement
7-5/8" intermediate Liner @ 10,030-11,159' integrity issues. RDMO to evaluate.

45.3# P-110 FL4S 1/6/04 TOH w/2-3/8" tbgCmtd w/ 600 sxs 16.1ppg class "G" 1/9/04 Ran Pulsed Neutron Log
1/14/04 Ran Cement Mapping Tool

**All in dications are water influx is via
fractures in the formation. Evaluate

isolation/recompletion options.

Nugget Sand Zi &Z2 Perfs
12752-72, 12800-20, 12854-94, 12960-80, O

13035-55, 13022-100, 13120-188 O

8 8
CIBP @13,202'wl cmt to 13,190'

Nuqqet Sand Z3 Perfs FA em
13210-72, 13294-402, 13426-94, 13520-78, Û Û

13640-720, 13760-850, 13872-956, 13980-98,
14048-141, 14168-270, 14292-326

4-1/2" Production Liner O 9919-14418'
15.1# P-110 LTC

7"x4-1/2" TlW Tie Back Sleeve @9919'
9-5/8"x7-5/8" TlW hydraulic hanger @9927 FISH PBTD: 14,338'
4" ID TlW polished bore recepticle @993T

Cmt'd w/ 140 sxs 11.0 ppg Dowell "Hi Lift"& 170 sxs 9.0 FISH
TD: 14,418'ppg Amoco"Bubble" (CBL shows poor bond)

Printed
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26# N-80 LTC (3303') 10/11/89 Add Zone 2 Perfs
29# N-80 LTC (504') TCP perf 13022-850 OA @6 spf & 60°

Cmtd w/ 200 sxs 15.8 ppg class "G" 12/12/89 Acidize AII
Pump 3,000g 15% HCL

4/20/90 Lost spinner tool @14,000'
11/93 convert to injector9-5/8"x4-1/2" TlW hydr hanger @9,92T

7/16/96 Attempted water shut-off4" ID TlW PBR @9,937
Dump 10,180# 20/40 sand &60' cmt (tag @

Missing Re
rt2 L

t @12,53T9-5/8" intermediate Casing 10,272' 12/22/00 Pull tbg and clean out53.5#N-80 LTC (83') Clean out cmt/sand & CIBP down to cmt @43.5# N-80 LTC (520')
13,266'. No tbg in well.40# N-80 LTC (3608')

1/10/01 Run new 3-1/2" tbg43.5# N-80 LTC (1606')
47# N-80 LTC (2204') Caliper shows good csg/liner above 10,318

53.5# N-80 LTC (2191') 11/13/03 Install 2-3/8" tbg
Cmtd w/ 500 sxs 14.2 ppg 50/50 poz & 300 sxs 15.8 Set CIBP @ 13,202' w/ 10' cmt. TCP perf

ppg class "G" 12,854-94' @4 spf. Stimulate entire
Toc Nugget interval w/ propellant sleeves.

Unable to swab down. Suspect cement
7-5/8" intermediate Liner @ 10,030-11,159' integrity issues. RDMO to evaluate.

45.3# P-110 FL4S 1/6/04 TOH w/2-3/8" tbgCmtd w/ 600 sxs 16.1ppg class "G" 1/9/04 Ran Pulsed Neutron Log
1/14/04 Ran Cement Mapping Tool

**All in dications are water influx is via
fractures in the formation. Evaluate

isolation/recompletion options.

Nugget Sand Zi &Z2 Perfs
12752-72, 12800-20, 12854-94, 12960-80, O

13035-55, 13022-100, 13120-188 O

8 8
CIBP @13,202'wl cmt to 13,190'

Nuqqet Sand Z3 Perfs FA em
13210-72, 13294-402, 13426-94, 13520-78, Û Û

13640-720, 13760-850, 13872-956, 13980-98,
14048-141, 14168-270, 14292-326

4-1/2" Production Liner O 9919-14418'
15.1# P-110 LTC

7"x4-1/2" TlW Tie Back Sleeve @9919'
9-5/8"x7-5/8" TlW hydraulic hanger @9927 FISH PBTD: 14,338'
4" ID TlW polished bore recepticle @993T

Cmt'd w/ 140 sxs 11.0 ppg Dowell "Hi Lift"& 170 sxs 9.0 FISH
TD: 14,418'ppg Amoco"Bubble" (CBL shows poor bond)

Printed



WELLNAME: ARE W16-06 FIELD: ANSCHUTZRANCHEAST
QTR QTR: SEC: 16 TWN: 4N RNG: SE
COUNTY: SUMMIT ST: UT SPUD DATE:
KB: 7344 GL: 7314 TD: 13493 PBTD:
LASTUPDATED: iMQ92g KON26 BY: MIKE MERCER

CASING DETAILS
PURPOSE SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH
SURFACE 13-3/8" 54.5# K-55 1998'
INTERMEDIATE 9-5/8" 40-47# S-95 7999'
INTERMEDIATE7-5/8" 45.3# P-110 F/7657-12044
PRODUCTION 4-1/2" 13.5# P-110 F/11007-13957

TUBING DETAILS
DESCRIPTION SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH
KB 30.00

8060-8200

TOL @ 11007

WELL HIETORY:
Oct-81 Perf 13918, sqz w/ 150 sxs. Perf 13835, sqz w/ 100 sxs

Perf 13800, sqz w/ 230 sxs
Perf 13896-908, acidizew/ 12009 7.5% HCL.
Set CICR @13850, sqz w/ 100 sxs
Perf 13812-830, acidizew/ 1350g 7.5% HCL

Nov-81 Perf 13794-796. Sqz 13794-796, 13812-830 w/ 200 sxs
Perf 13770-780, acidizew/ 500g 7.5% HCL
Perf 13755-780. Sqz 13755-780 w/ 150 s×sså Dec-81 Perf 13792-794. Sqz w/ ??? Sxs

NUGGET PERFS Perf 13755-770, acidize w/ 1500g 15% HCL
13440-458, 13480-548 Set CICR @ 13687, sqz w/ ??? Sxs
Three cones off bit Jan-82 DO CICR to 13688. Perf 13664-685, acidizew/ 2200g 7.5% HCL

Perf 13440-458, 13480-548, 13578-610
CICR @ 13563' Acidize w/ 9000g 7.5% HCL
NUGGET PERFS (SQZD) 08/06/91 Set CICR @ 13563, sqz w/ 380 sxs
13578-610, 13664-685 08/12/91 Milledtitespot in casing f/ 8060-8200 w/ 6.28" OD tapered mill

08/18/91 Perf 13440-458, 13480-548 thru tubing
CIBP @ 13688' (PARTIAt 04/10/01 TIH w/ 3-3/4" bit, tag fill © 13449', DO to 13498
NUGGET PERFS (SQZD) 04/11/01 Lost 3 cones off of bit
13755-770, 13770-80 04/13/01 2 magnet runs, no recovery, impression block,circle in center
13792-794, 13794-796 04/20/01 Tag @ 13498, washover fill to 13508. Rec'd sand.
13800 (SQZ) 04/25/01 SD WO.SI wellw/ 27 landingjoint.
13812-830
13835 (SQZ)

CICR @ 13850' OTHER INFORMATION:
NUGGET PERFS (SQZD) PBTD - 13498'. Bottom 50' of perfs are covered up.13896-908
13918
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PRODUCTION 4-1/2" 13.5# P-110 F/11007-13957
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13440-458, 13480-548 Set CICR @ 13687, sqz w/ ??? Sxs
Three cones off bit Jan-82 DO CICR to 13688. Perf 13664-685, acidizew/ 2200g 7.5% HCL

Perf 13440-458, 13480-548, 13578-610
CICR @ 13563' Acidize w/ 9000g 7.5% HCL
NUGGET PERFS (SQZD) 08/06/91 Set CICR @ 13563, sqz w/ 380 sxs
13578-610, 13664-685 08/12/91 Milledtitespot in casing f/ 8060-8200 w/ 6.28" OD tapered mill

08/18/91 Perf 13440-458, 13480-548 thru tubing
CIBP @ 13688' (PARTIAt 04/10/01 TIH w/ 3-3/4" bit, tag fill © 13449', DO to 13498
NUGGET PERFS (SQZD) 04/11/01 Lost 3 cones off of bit
13755-770, 13770-80 04/13/01 2 magnet runs, no recovery, impression block,circle in center
13792-794, 13794-796 04/20/01 Tag @ 13498, washover fill to 13508. Rec'd sand.
13800 (SQZ) 04/25/01 SD WO.SI wellw/ 27 landingjoint.
13812-830
13835 (SQZ)

CICR @ 13850' OTHER INFORMATION:
NUGGET PERFS (SQZD) PBTD - 13498'. Bottom 50' of perfs are covered up.13896-908
13918



MERIT ENERGY COMPANY

WELLNAME: CHAMPLIN 387 B1A FIELD: ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST
QTR QTR: SEC: 9 TWN: 3N RNG: 7E
COUNTY: SUMMIT ST: UT SPUD DATE: 10/04/80
KB: 7342 GL: 7327 TD: 8309 PBTD: 7800
LASTUPDATED: 01/11/05 BY: MIKE MERCER

CASING DETAILS
PURPOSE SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH
SURFACE 9-5/8" 32.3# 1412'
PRODUCTION 7" 23, 26# 8299'

TUBING DETAILS
DESCRIPTION SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH

WATTON CANYON PERFf
7200-7220
7224-7230, 7248-7256
7268-7274, 7282-7298
7308-7314, 7332-7350
7390-7404, 7432-7446
7500-7520, 7540-7550
CICR @ 7800
7818-7910

CICR @ 7900

MERIT ENERGY COMPANY

WELLNAME: CHAMPLIN 387 B1A FIELD: ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST
QTR QTR: SEC: 9 TWN: 3N RNG: 7E
COUNTY: SUMMIT ST: UT SPUD DATE: 10/04/80
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PRODUCTION 7" 23, 26# 8299'

TUBING DETAILS
DESCRIPTION SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH

WATTON CANYON PERFf
7200-7220
7224-7230, 7248-7256
7268-7274, 7282-7298
7308-7314, 7332-7350
7390-7404, 7432-7446
7500-7520, 7540-7550
CICR @ 7800
7818-7910

CICR @ 7900



WELLBORE DI, AM
Fleid: Anschutzaoh
Well: CH 372 C #1

SEC: 23 TWP: 4N RGE: 7E

KB 16.70'
DEPTH KB

Ingram Cactus 11" 3M by T SMwlR2 bottom &6 bowl
tbgspool(7' 26# csg stub fanded in siips)

Note: Casing pressure testedfrom 0-3600'
to 1000 psig 2/16/01 -passed

9 5/8 32.3# H-40 ST & C csg sel at 1518' I

NOTE:HOLEWCSGat3612· I C
(Casing patch set from 3582' to 3635')

2-3/8" 4.7# EUE Brnd Tubing

Annulus pressure tested to 1000 psig (2/27/2001)

4-1/2" 12.60# Tubing run to surface
New Vam Beveled Couplings

4-1/2" Liner Top with BPR
Cement top7" per CBL on 2/15/98 Cemented in place at 5090
logged by Schlumberger at 4906'+ - inflatible packer

8320' MD
-•. EC 7750 MD Openh0Ìe

Whipstock at 5600' MD (5513' TVD) ' •- · - .

NOTE' Shoe7aso MD TD = 8608' MD
Tvda creeka Nugget squeezed off as fonows, 6648' TVD
2/12/98 pumped 410 sx'G"+ addlivegno pressure 7" 26# S-95 & K-55 casing - 2296.62' MIN MAX
2/13/98 Dumped 100 sx "G" neat &200 ex'G"+ addaims O_D
no pressure Gement cap at 6018,22' - tagged via tbg
2/14/9B pumped 50sx 10-0 RFC And obtain 1150 osi soueeze
2(14/98 pump 29 sx "G" fortopoutomt cap on too of retaine< Hanibutton Modei "HCS" cement retainer S.S" 6051.98'

(set via tbg - Bottom at 6054.11')

Cut off 2 3/8" 4.7# N-80 CS hWrilIbg 1.90 1" 2.375' 6071'

X-over 2 318"os to2 ais-Brd 1.901" 3.062· 6089.49'
Spacertube 1.907 2,375" 6090.29

BakermodelA-5dualpacker 1.901" 6,093° 6092.81'
Spacer tube,shortstring:
Spacer tube,X-omr, 2 3/8" pup, Model "E' hyd Spacer tube 1.901 2.375" 6098.13'
trip sub, 2 3/8" pup, Model "F" nipple,Perfd pup, X-Omr: 2 3/8" to2 3/8" 10rd toSrd 1.901 2.875" 6099.43'
i Jt2 3/8°tbg, Baker mode!"R" npple, Mtde shoe X¾ 2 3/8° to2 7/8" sid 1.901 3.00" 6099,75'
Avg oo'sa lo's: ID 1.901" & OD 2.97 Perfd tubing: 4 shots (4 spf) 6103.57
Oæran length: 48.73
EOT at 6141.54

29)ttof27/8"6.5#8rdtbg 2.441" 3.668" 6100.OT
Tbg collars: 3,668" - Tube: 2 875"

T C k PeOrfs:

Baker Model -F" nipple 1.ar 3.6876" 6994.86'
ijtof27/8*6.6#8rdtbg 2.441" 3.668" 6995.8T
Baker modelG-22 locator assembly 2.406" 3.48875" 7023.95'
Baker moderretrievaD*packer 3.25' 6.093· g
Bakermodel80-32sealassembly 2.406" 2.688" 7036.66.
X-Oær:2 3/8" 10rd BX by BX 1.906" 3,062" 7037,09'
X-Over 2 3/8' NU to EU 1.906" 3.067 7037.46'
1 jt of 2 3/8" EU ssd 1.90r 3,087 7069.12'

Nu t Pe Baker model 'R" nipple 1.760" 2 97 7069.89'
7056 thru 7098' Mule shoe couas . 1.90f 2 97 7071.21'

FISH: 2 3/8"tbg (25') PBTD;

7" 23#& 26# at 7300.25' : :
N, .

.-.

JDI
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ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST UNITW31-04
Summit County, Utah

Location: 731' FWL & 8T FNL Sec 31-T4N-R7E
Elevation:7894'GLI 7926' KB
Last Updated by CAM 12/17/2007

WELL HISTORY & NOTES30" Conductor Casinq @71'
cemented to surface

11/82 Completed as a Z1/Z2/Z3 Injector
Acidize w/ 8000 gals 7.5% HCL20" Conductor Casinq @ 299' 8/82 Set cmt RET and squeeze94#, K-55,ST&C Set @11760';Pump 75 sxs G cmt;cemented to surface w/ 775 sxs class "A"

Perf 13588-590, 13582-584, 13420-22, set
retainer @13438,squeeze

DOcmt 12623-13012, pressure testok
7/93 Run replacement pkr and tubing

string
1/96 Replace tubing string with 13%

13-3/8" Surface Casinq @2,672' chrome
541' of 61# K-55; 321' of 54.5# K-55; 1119' of 61# J-55; Good 900 psi casing test

39' of 61# S-80; 620' of 61# J-55; 11/99 Drill 2 laterals and cement 4" DP
ALL ST&C and perfCmt w/ 1700 sxs 50/50 Poz/"A"& 636 sxs class "G" neat. Notes:

From reports is it suspected that the
south lateral has a significant amount of
cement. High water rates are the reason9-5/8" intermediate Casinq @11,695' the well was shut-in. Highest recorded257' of 53.5# S-95; 1112' of 47# S-95; 1314' of 43.5# S-95; 1609' of

40# S-95; 1555' of 43.5# S-95; 2035' of 47# S-95; 848' of 53.5# S- water rate was 250 bwpd in 2000.
95; 1055' of 53.5# S-95; 856' of 53.5# CYS-95; 1027' of 62.8# S-

105
ALL LT&C

Cemented with 2200 sxs of Class G

Squeeze 10340'-342
Holes 10550'-552

11052'-054 SOZD
11708'-710' SQZD

7" DV tool @11836'
Top of poor cement at 11900'

Tubinq Detail(North Lateral):
3-1/2" 12.7# VAMN-80 set at 12,860'

X-over: 3-1/2" x 4-1/2"
x-over: 4-1/2" x 4" HT 38

4" HT38 Drillpipe to 13970' MD (??TVD)Squeeze perfs: 12994-96 Baker payzone pkr @ 14,000 MD13268-72 12995 76' ft of logging tools at 14,478' MD
Squeeze perfs: 13416-19 Cemented to 13130'

4" DP perforated from 13,310'-13460'; 13,820'-13,970'

Tubing Detail(South Lateral):
Kickoff from North lateral @13,126'

Nuqqet Sand Zi/Z2 Peg O 5-7/8" OH to plug @14023'
12998-13000(SQZD w/200 sxs), 13055-13096, 13111-128, Û

13138-187, 13200-232, 13257-261(SQZD w/50sxs) Q13290-13356, 13376-13450

7" Production Casinq (ã)14,303'
816': 26# S-95 8rd

13515' 4358': 23# S-95 8rd
4066': 26# S-95 8rd

Nuqqet Sand Z2/Z3 Perfs 394': 32# N-80 Brd
13588-13630, 13660-13760, 13790-13850, 13874-13932' PBTD 14,202 1290': 32# S-95 8rd

14030-14070, 14100-14140 9 : 335 9955

cemented with325 sxs Class G
TD@ 14,303'lVD

South Lateral TD: 14,023' MD
North Lateral TD: 14,478' MD

Printed
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Summit County, Utah

Location: 731' FWL & 8T FNL Sec 31-T4N-R7E
Elevation:7894'GLI 7926' KB
Last Updated by CAM 12/17/2007

WELL HISTORY & NOTES30" Conductor Casinq @71'
cemented to surface

11/82 Completed as a Z1/Z2/Z3 Injector
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Squeeze perfs: 13416-19 Cemented to 13130'
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13138-187, 13200-232, 13257-261(SQZD w/50sxs) Q13290-13356, 13376-13450
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Printed



WELLNAME: ARE W20-06 FIELD: ANSCHUTZRANCH EASTQTR QTR: SEC: 20 7WN: 4N RNG: SECOUNTY: SUMMIT ST: UT SPUD DATE: 05/19/81KLA
T

UP7D5A
D:

GL: 534 63 PBY:D: 13823
NICKTUNNELL

CASING DETAILS
PURPOSE SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH
SURFACE 13-3/8", 13-1/2" 61-81.4# N-80, S-80, S-95 5411'
INTERMEDIATE9-5/8", 9-7/8" 43.5-62.8# S-95 11330'
PRODUCTION 7", 6-5/8" 26-32# N-80, P-110 14163'

TUBING DETA)LS
DESCRIFTIONSIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTHKB 29.00TBG 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80
PKR 12,858'

Top of 6-5/8"
@ 10079'

All depths are esimates based on "Daily Activity Re3ort" dated 06/2/J4

NUGGET PERFS:
13008-038, 13046-064
13092-115 WELL HISTORY:

CIBP w/ cmt @13220' 01/01/82 Initial completion - perPd 13966-990, 13910-930, 13628-65013230-310 13606-618, 13514-533, 13680-692, 13699-708, 13716-726
1 R8¾Ï 13736-746, 13772-800, 13830-860, 13556-580, 13248-268Å$Ž¾ŠŠ$1 13292-346, 13370-392, 13418-446, 13470-490.
13370-392, 13418-446 Sqzd 13910-990
13470-490, 13514-533 09/20/83 Sqzd 13680-692 (for conformance). Perfd 13610-22, 13632-54
13556-580, 13606-618 07/29/86 Sqzd 13248-346 (OA)13628-650 Perf d 13370-92, 13418-46, 13470-90, 13514-33
PKR @ 13670' 09/05/86 Perfd 13135-215, 13092-115, sqzd 13092-215

0-692 (sqzd) 07/01/92 Replace corroded tbg, Perfd 13008-38, 13046-64, 13092-115
1369§ 2) 03/22/96 Perfd 13230-310...may have squeeze some perfs,no records13736-746, 13772-800 03/10/04 Pulled tubingand packer,selectively swab testedPKR © 13791'
RBP @ 13803'
13830-860 (fill)
CICR @ 13886'

Fish @ 13995': Junk

WELLNAME: ARE W20-06 FIELD: ANSCHUTZRANCH EASTQTR QTR: SEC: 20 7WN: 4N RNG: SECOUNTY: SUMMIT ST: UT SPUD DATE: 05/19/81KLA
T

UP7D5A
D:

GL: 534 63 PBY:D: 13823
NICKTUNNELL

CASING DETAILS
PURPOSE SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH
SURFACE 13-3/8", 13-1/2" 61-81.4# N-80, S-80, S-95 5411'
INTERMEDIATE9-5/8", 9-7/8" 43.5-62.8# S-95 11330'
PRODUCTION 7", 6-5/8" 26-32# N-80, P-110 14163'

TUBING DETA)LS
DESCRIFTIONSIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTHKB 29.00TBG 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80
PKR 12,858'

Top of 6-5/8"
@ 10079'

All depths are esimates based on "Daily Activity Re3ort" dated 06/2/J4

NUGGET PERFS:
13008-038, 13046-064
13092-115 WELL HISTORY:

CIBP w/ cmt @13220' 01/01/82 Initial completion - perPd 13966-990, 13910-930, 13628-65013230-310 13606-618, 13514-533, 13680-692, 13699-708, 13716-726
1 R8¾Ï 13736-746, 13772-800, 13830-860, 13556-580, 13248-268Å$Ž¾ŠŠ$1 13292-346, 13370-392, 13418-446, 13470-490.
13370-392, 13418-446 Sqzd 13910-990
13470-490, 13514-533 09/20/83 Sqzd 13680-692 (for conformance). Perfd 13610-22, 13632-54
13556-580, 13606-618 07/29/86 Sqzd 13248-346 (OA)13628-650 Perf d 13370-92, 13418-46, 13470-90, 13514-33
PKR @ 13670' 09/05/86 Perfd 13135-215, 13092-115, sqzd 13092-215

0-692 (sqzd) 07/01/92 Replace corroded tbg, Perfd 13008-38, 13046-64, 13092-115
1369§ 2) 03/22/96 Perfd 13230-310...may have squeeze some perfs,no records13736-746, 13772-800 03/10/04 Pulled tubingand packer,selectively swab testedPKR © 13791'
RBP @ 13803'
13830-860 (fill)
CICR @ 13886'

Fish @ 13995': Junk



ELLNAME: ARE W17-16 FIELD: ANSCHUTZ RANCH EASTR QTR: SEC: 17 TWN: 4N RNG: 8E
OUNTY: SUMMIT ST: UT SPUD DATE:

KB: 7375 GL: 7350 TD: 14671 PBTD: 14140
LASTUPDATED: ) §§?]¾¾†¾6208 BY: NICKTUNNELL

CASING DETAILS
PURPOSE SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEFTH
SURFACE 13-3/8" 2526'
INTERMEDIATE9-5/8" 10701'
INTERMEDIATE7-5/8" F/10371-11800
PRODUCTION 5" 18# P-110 F/10237-14671
PRODUCTION 7" F/0-10237

TUBING DETAILS
DESCRIPTION SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH

TOC @ 10371'

WELL HIETORY:

PKR @13747

NUGGETPERFS
13806-844, 13864-912
13932-976, 14010-040
14064-094

4

5RO81041S40ZD)

O DVTOOL. 7" ©

ELLNAME: ARE W17-16 FIELD: ANSCHUTZ RANCH EASTR QTR: SEC: 17 TWN: 4N RNG: 8E
OUNTY: SUMMIT ST: UT SPUD DATE:

KB: 7375 GL: 7350 TD: 14671 PBTD: 14140
LASTUPDATED: ) §§?]¾¾†¾6208 BY: NICKTUNNELL

CASING DETAILS
PURPOSE SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEFTH
SURFACE 13-3/8" 2526'
INTERMEDIATE9-5/8" 10701'
INTERMEDIATE7-5/8" F/10371-11800
PRODUCTION 5" 18# P-110 F/10237-14671
PRODUCTION 7" F/0-10237

TUBING DETAILS
DESCRIPTION SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH

TOC @ 10371'

WELL HIETORY:

PKR @13747

NUGGETPERFS
13806-844, 13864-912
13932-976, 14010-040
14064-094

4

5RO81041S40ZD)

O DVTOOL. 7" ©



:E WELLNAME: ARE W20-02 FIELD: ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST
QTRQTR: SEC: 20 TWN: 4N RNG: 8E
COUNTY: SUMMIT ST: UT SPUD DATE: 05/01/83
KB: 7331 GL: 7310 TD: 13928 PBTD: 12950
LASTUPDATED: Mg/g%0¾ BY: CASEY MORTON

CASING DETAILS
PURPOSE SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SETDEPTH
SURFACE 13-3/8", 13-5/8" 54.5-88.2# K-55, HC-95 5140'
INTERMEDIATE 9-5/8", 9-7/8" 47-62.8# MC-95, S-105 10934'
PRODUCTION 7" 32-35# N-80, S-95 13928'
Has an additional20" surface casing string set @60', not shown on WBS

TUBING DETA)LS
DESCRIFTION SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH
KB 21.00
82 JTS 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 2,650.53
GLV #7 2-7/8" 2,657.57
78 JTS 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 5,139.88
GLV#6 2-7/8" 5,146.91
68 JTS 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 7,311.03
GLV#5 2-7/8" 7,318.05
58 JTS 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 9,167.66
GLV#4 2-7/8" 9,174.68
48 JTS 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 10,692,10
GLV#3 2-7/8" 10,699.12
34 JTS 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 11,784.19
GLV#2 2-7/8" 11,791.22
24 JTS 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 12,558.46
GLV#1 2-7/8" 12,565.48
1 JT 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 12,597.76
X NIPPLE 2.313" 12,598.80
1 JT 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 12,631.08
ON/OFF TOOL 2-7/8" X 5-1/2" 12,632.90
PUP JT 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 12,638.98
ASI-X PKR 2-7/8" X 7" 12,646.52
PUP JT 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 12,652.60
XN NIPPLE 2.313" W/ NO Gi 12,653.73

DVT Jol at 12203' PUP JT 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 12,659.78
WL REENTY 2-7/8" 12,660.46
Based on 03/18/J4 Pulling Report

WELL HISTORY:
08/18/83 Perf Z3 f/ 13476-560, acidizew/ 6300g 10% HCL

Perf Z2 f/ 13004-430 (OA) w/ TCP.
Acidize allw/ 600 bbisacid

10/17/84 Left 7 of PLT toolin hole
01/08/86 Sqz 13004-108 w/ 150 sxs

Perf Z1 f/ 12739-924 (OA) w/ TCP (no stimulation)
02/15/86 PLT indicates flowf/ 5 of 11 zones

NUGGET Z1 PERFS 07/29/86 Test lowerZ2 & Z3
12739-768, 12778-784 09/09/86 Convert to injection, perf Z2 f/ 13005-065, 13080-110
12792-811, 12831-864 03/01/95 Convert to production
12890-899, 12912-924 05/18/98 Attempt WSO, spot 27 bbl cmt f/ 12950-13628 (tagged@ 12951)

02/01/04 Set CIBP at 12990? RIH with gas lift
NUGGET Z2 PERFS
13005-065, 13080-110 (w/ 1/4 spf, 0 phasing)
13127-152, 13164-220
13232-256, 13280-308
13320-360, 13372-430

NUGGET Z3 PERFS
13475-560
All perfs shot w/ 4 spf 90 phasing unless noted otherwise

DVTOOL. 13 3/8" @ ????, 7 @

:E WELLNAME: ARE W20-02 FIELD: ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST
QTRQTR: SEC: 20 TWN: 4N RNG: 8E
COUNTY: SUMMIT ST: UT SPUD DATE: 05/01/83
KB: 7331 GL: 7310 TD: 13928 PBTD: 12950
LASTUPDATED: Mg/g%0¾ BY: CASEY MORTON

CASING DETAILS
PURPOSE SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SETDEPTH
SURFACE 13-3/8", 13-5/8" 54.5-88.2# K-55, HC-95 5140'
INTERMEDIATE 9-5/8", 9-7/8" 47-62.8# MC-95, S-105 10934'
PRODUCTION 7" 32-35# N-80, S-95 13928'
Has an additional20" surface casing string set @60', not shown on WBS

TUBING DETA)LS
DESCRIFTION SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH
KB 21.00
82 JTS 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 2,650.53
GLV #7 2-7/8" 2,657.57
78 JTS 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 5,139.88
GLV#6 2-7/8" 5,146.91
68 JTS 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 7,311.03
GLV#5 2-7/8" 7,318.05
58 JTS 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 9,167.66
GLV#4 2-7/8" 9,174.68
48 JTS 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 10,692,10
GLV#3 2-7/8" 10,699.12
34 JTS 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 11,784.19
GLV#2 2-7/8" 11,791.22
24 JTS 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 12,558.46
GLV#1 2-7/8" 12,565.48
1 JT 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 12,597.76
X NIPPLE 2.313" 12,598.80
1 JT 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 12,631.08
ON/OFF TOOL 2-7/8" X 5-1/2" 12,632.90
PUP JT 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 12,638.98
ASI-X PKR 2-7/8" X 7" 12,646.52
PUP JT 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 12,652.60
XN NIPPLE 2.313" W/ NO Gi 12,653.73

DVT Jol at 12203' PUP JT 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 12,659.78
WL REENTY 2-7/8" 12,660.46
Based on 03/18/J4 Pulling Report

WELL HISTORY:
08/18/83 Perf Z3 f/ 13476-560, acidizew/ 6300g 10% HCL

Perf Z2 f/ 13004-430 (OA) w/ TCP.
Acidize allw/ 600 bbisacid

10/17/84 Left 7 of PLT toolin hole
01/08/86 Sqz 13004-108 w/ 150 sxs

Perf Z1 f/ 12739-924 (OA) w/ TCP (no stimulation)
02/15/86 PLT indicates flowf/ 5 of 11 zones

NUGGET Z1 PERFS 07/29/86 Test lowerZ2 & Z3
12739-768, 12778-784 09/09/86 Convert to injection, perf Z2 f/ 13005-065, 13080-110
12792-811, 12831-864 03/01/95 Convert to production
12890-899, 12912-924 05/18/98 Attempt WSO, spot 27 bbl cmt f/ 12950-13628 (tagged@ 12951)

02/01/04 Set CIBP at 12990? RIH with gas lift
NUGGET Z2 PERFS
13005-065, 13080-110 (w/ 1/4 spf, 0 phasing)
13127-152, 13164-220
13232-256, 13280-308
13320-360, 13372-430

NUGGET Z3 PERFS
13475-560
All perfs shot w/ 4 spf 90 phasing unless noted otherwise

DVTOOL. 13 3/8" @ ????, 7 @



PROPOSED WELLBORE

WELLNAME: ARE W20-12 FIELD: ANSCHUTZ RANCH EASTQTRQTR: SEC: 20 TV/N: 4N RNG: 8E
COUNTY: SUMMIT ST: UT SPUD DATE:
KB: GL: TD: 14084 PBTD: 13142
LASTUPDATED: g¾ RKOT/g§¾ BY: NICKTUNNELL

CASING DETAILS
PURPOSE SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SETDEPTH
SURFACE 13-3/8" 5362'
INTERMEDIATE9-5/8" 11245'
LINER 7" F/10571-11967
LINER 4-1/2" 15# P-110, FL4S F/10109-13994
TIEBACK 7"
Has an additional20" surface casing string set @ 277', not shown on WBS
TUBING DETAILS
DESCRIPTION SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH
KB 0.00

WELL HISTORY:
03/03/97 Perf'd 12948-968, 13008-024, 13040-060, 13174-194

Sqz Perfs @ 11976-977 08/01/03 Set CICR @ 13295, Sqzd Nugget w/ 150 sxs
08/11/03 Perfd Nugget 13060-13117
08/12/03 PerPd Nugget 12928-13060

PKR @ 12863' 08/13/03 Set CIBP @13142
08/18/03 AcidizedNugget f/12928-13117 w/ 3000g 15% HCL(foamed)

NUGGET PERFS
12928-13117

CMT @ 13152' (08/08/03)
13174-194, 13202-242
13250-262, 13274-284
CICR @ 13295' (sqz w/ 150 sxs)
13302-336
13342-415, 13420-454
13472-498, 13526-536
13570-612, 13620-665

CIBP @ 13673' (w/ 29' cmt on top)
13680-745, 13780-864
Fill@ 13875 (06/24/99)

DVTOOL 13-3/8" @

PROPOSED WELLBORE

WELLNAME: ARE W20-12 FIELD: ANSCHUTZ RANCH EASTQTRQTR: SEC: 20 TV/N: 4N RNG: 8E
COUNTY: SUMMIT ST: UT SPUD DATE:
KB: GL: TD: 14084 PBTD: 13142
LASTUPDATED: g¾ RKOT/g§¾ BY: NICKTUNNELL

CASING DETAILS
PURPOSE SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SETDEPTH
SURFACE 13-3/8" 5362'
INTERMEDIATE9-5/8" 11245'
LINER 7" F/10571-11967
LINER 4-1/2" 15# P-110, FL4S F/10109-13994
TIEBACK 7"
Has an additional20" surface casing string set @ 277', not shown on WBS
TUBING DETAILS
DESCRIPTION SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH
KB 0.00

WELL HISTORY:
03/03/97 Perf'd 12948-968, 13008-024, 13040-060, 13174-194

Sqz Perfs @ 11976-977 08/01/03 Set CICR @ 13295, Sqzd Nugget w/ 150 sxs
08/11/03 Perfd Nugget 13060-13117
08/12/03 PerPd Nugget 12928-13060

PKR @ 12863' 08/13/03 Set CIBP @13142
08/18/03 AcidizedNugget f/12928-13117 w/ 3000g 15% HCL(foamed)

NUGGET PERFS
12928-13117

CMT @ 13152' (08/08/03)
13174-194, 13202-242
13250-262, 13274-284
CICR @ 13295' (sqz w/ 150 sxs)
13302-336
13342-415, 13420-454
13472-498, 13526-536
13570-612, 13620-665

CIBP @ 13673' (w/ 29' cmt on top)
13680-745, 13780-864
Fill@ 13875 (06/24/99)

DVTOOL 13-3/8" @



WELLNAME: ARE W31-06 FIELD: ANSCHUTZ RANCHEAST
QTR QTR: SEC: 31 TWN: 4N RNG: 8E
COUNTY: SUMMIT ST: UT SPUDDATE:
KB: 7770 GL: 7743 TD: 14330 PBTD: 13367
LASTUPDATED: M g8¾¶ëiOft BY; CASEYMORTON

CASING DETAILS
PURPOSE SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH
SURFACE 13-3/8" 54.5-61# K-55 2301'
INTERMEDIATE 9-5/8", 9-7/8" 47-62.8# N-80, S-105 10689'
PRODUCTION 7' 32-38# N-80, P-110 14033'

TOC Has an additional20" surface casing string set @ 107, not shown on WBS
30

TUBING DETAILS
DESCRIPTION SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH
KB 27.00
326 JTS 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 10,269.42
PUP 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 10,275.50
ON/OFF 10,277.02
ARROWSETPKR 10,284.73

TOC 56 JTS 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 12,048.52
9996 X NIPPLE 12,049.72

1 JT 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 12,081.06
XN NIPPLE 12,082.34
1 JT 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 12,114.74
WL REENTRY 12,115.16
Based on tubingdetails 12/10/04
COILED TUBING DETAILS LENGTH SET DEPTH
1-1/4" CT 8992.0 8,992.00
GLV#8 SJ 40 1" GLVw/ 3/16" PORT 8.0 9,000.00
1-1/4" CT 942.0 9,942.00
GLV#7 SJ 40 1" GLVw/ 3/16" PORT 8.0 9,950.00
1-1/4" CT 792.0 10,742.00

See Note GLV#6 SJ 40 1" GLVw/ 3/16" PORT 8.0 10,750.00
1-1/4" CT 592.0 11,342.00
GLV#5 SJ 40 1" GLVw/ 3/16" PORT 8.0 11,350.00
1-1/4" CT 542.0 11,892.00

10604' GLV#4 SJ 40 1" GLVw/ 3/16" PORT 8.0 11,900.00
1-1/4" CT 392.0 12,292.00
GLV#3 SJ 40 1" GLVw/ 3/16" PORT 8.0 12,300.00
1-1/4" CT 392.0 12,692.00
GLV#2 SJ 40 1" GLVw/ 3/16" PORT 8.0 12,700.00
1-1/4" CT 392.0 13,092.00
GLV#1 1" GLVw/ 3/16" S/O 8.0 13,100.00

25% Based on coiledtubingdetails 04/14/05
bond WELL HISTORY:

NUGGET PERFS 09/01/83 CompleteZ2 & Z3
12171-188, 12194-228 06/01/85 Perf & Acidize Z1
12238-254, 12256-262 03/01/86 Add Z1, Z2 & OT pay
12270-308, 12310-364 02/01/89 Add Z3 & OT pay
12410-454, 12462-470 04/01/89 CloseSS - OT only
12472-548, 12551-618 04/01/90 Open SS - NS/OT

4-12638-745, 12746-776 04/01/92 Replace corroded tubing
12820-850, 12860-892 04/01/95 Replace corroded tubingw/ Chrome
12902-940, 12952-974 10/01/96 Frac Z1 & Z2
12992-13058 03/28/01 Pulledpkr, ran 2-7/8" tubing(no packer)
HINGELINE 07/01/01 Gas lifted("Poor Boy")
13130-212, 13230-282 05/01/03 Chemicalhot oilfor paraffin, net increase 1 mmcfd
13330-450 08/01/04 Shut off lift gas (circulating)
13460-462 (sqzd) 09/11/04 WLTD - taggedfill@ 13367 (sand in bailer)
13471-490, 13508-574 12/01/04 CO Fillto new PBTD 14060'
13596-668, 13704-816, 138 14-974
Fish @ 14165 : OpenEHSolelogging tool (39 1' iong, 3-3/8 0010416'

(CALIPER MAR-

DVTOOL '" @ 10604'

WELLNAME: ARE W31-06 FIELD: ANSCHUTZ RANCHEAST
QTR QTR: SEC: 31 TWN: 4N RNG: 8E
COUNTY: SUMMIT ST: UT SPUDDATE:
KB: 7770 GL: 7743 TD: 14330 PBTD: 13367
LASTUPDATED: M g8¾¶ëiOft BY; CASEYMORTON

CASING DETAILS
PURPOSE SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH
SURFACE 13-3/8" 54.5-61# K-55 2301'
INTERMEDIATE 9-5/8", 9-7/8" 47-62.8# N-80, S-105 10689'
PRODUCTION 7' 32-38# N-80, P-110 14033'

TOC Has an additional20" surface casing string set @ 107, not shown on WBS
30

TUBING DETAILS
DESCRIPTION SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH
KB 27.00
326 JTS 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 10,269.42
PUP 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 10,275.50
ON/OFF 10,277.02
ARROWSETPKR 10,284.73

TOC 56 JTS 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 12,048.52
9996 X NIPPLE 12,049.72

1 JT 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 12,081.06
XN NIPPLE 12,082.34
1 JT 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 12,114.74
WL REENTRY 12,115.16
Based on tubingdetails 12/10/04
COILED TUBING DETAILS LENGTH SET DEPTH
1-1/4" CT 8992.0 8,992.00
GLV#8 SJ 40 1" GLVw/ 3/16" PORT 8.0 9,000.00
1-1/4" CT 942.0 9,942.00
GLV#7 SJ 40 1" GLVw/ 3/16" PORT 8.0 9,950.00
1-1/4" CT 792.0 10,742.00

See Note GLV#6 SJ 40 1" GLVw/ 3/16" PORT 8.0 10,750.00
1-1/4" CT 592.0 11,342.00
GLV#5 SJ 40 1" GLVw/ 3/16" PORT 8.0 11,350.00
1-1/4" CT 542.0 11,892.00

10604' GLV#4 SJ 40 1" GLVw/ 3/16" PORT 8.0 11,900.00
1-1/4" CT 392.0 12,292.00
GLV#3 SJ 40 1" GLVw/ 3/16" PORT 8.0 12,300.00
1-1/4" CT 392.0 12,692.00
GLV#2 SJ 40 1" GLVw/ 3/16" PORT 8.0 12,700.00
1-1/4" CT 392.0 13,092.00
GLV#1 1" GLVw/ 3/16" S/O 8.0 13,100.00

25% Based on coiledtubingdetails 04/14/05
bond WELL HISTORY:

NUGGET PERFS 09/01/83 CompleteZ2 & Z3
12171-188, 12194-228 06/01/85 Perf & Acidize Z1
12238-254, 12256-262 03/01/86 Add Z1, Z2 & OT pay
12270-308, 12310-364 02/01/89 Add Z3 & OT pay
12410-454, 12462-470 04/01/89 CloseSS - OT only
12472-548, 12551-618 04/01/90 Open SS - NS/OT

4-12638-745, 12746-776 04/01/92 Replace corroded tubing
12820-850, 12860-892 04/01/95 Replace corroded tubingw/ Chrome
12902-940, 12952-974 10/01/96 Frac Z1 & Z2
12992-13058 03/28/01 Pulledpkr, ran 2-7/8" tubing(no packer)
HINGELINE 07/01/01 Gas lifted("Poor Boy")
13130-212, 13230-282 05/01/03 Chemicalhot oilfor paraffin, net increase 1 mmcfd
13330-450 08/01/04 Shut off lift gas (circulating)
13460-462 (sqzd) 09/11/04 WLTD - taggedfill@ 13367 (sand in bailer)
13471-490, 13508-574 12/01/04 CO Fillto new PBTD 14060'
13596-668, 13704-816, 138 14-974
Fish @ 14165 : OpenEHSolelogging tool (39 1' iong, 3-3/8 0010416'

(CALIPER MAR-

DVTOOL '" @ 10604'



'N Wellbore DiagramMELUT ENERGY COMPANY

Lease &Well No. ARE W36-16(FKA: Island Ranch E-1) CPF Name Gas GathedngFieldName AnschutzRanch East Countv & State summitcounty,UT
Locatfori sec. 36, 4N7E A

Well Information
Jurrent · spletlotGround Elevation: 8,070' Spud Date: 2/01/62

KB Elevation: 8,108' CompletionDate:

Plugback Depth: Current Prod: Oil- 0 bopd
TotalDepth: Gas - 185 mcípd

Water- 175bwpd
Comments: Schlumberger colled tubing gas lift setup FTP - 7

No MeritReports in PA FCP - ?
SITP - 7
S1CP - 7

SIBHP - 7

PI e Data

Top Bottom Size Weight Grade Sx. Cmt Comments
0' O' 0 Unk Unk Unk

Top Bottom Size Wolght Grade Sx. Cmt Comments
O' 2,888' 13-3/8" 54.5&61# K-55

Top Bottom Size Weight Grade Sx. Cmt Comments
0' 6,833' 9-5/8" 47.0# HC-95 Unk D_V 5662

Top Bottom Size Weight Grade Sx. Omt Comments
0' 11,817' 7" 32-35# S-95 Unk 32#-8230', 29#.10489'
10,470' 34,775' 4-1/2" 15.1# P-110 Unk 4"1D PBR @ 10748

mŒÐT4mmmWNEemimi HEREMMMM Wi
Description Length Bottom Size Min, ID Weight Grade

KB 38.00' 38.00

318jfs 9,854.00' 9,892.00' 3-1/2" 10.3# VAM;N-80

24 Jts 743.72' 10,635.72' 3-1/2" 9.2# Chrome
R-Nipple 1.00' 10,636.72' 3-1/2" 2.562

1Jt 31.00' 10,667.72' 3-1/2" 9.2# Chmme
On/Off tool 1.00' 10,668.72' 5-1/2 x 3-1/2"

Pup Joint 6.00' 10,874.72' 3-1/2" VAM 1
BakerFHL packer 6.00' 10,680.72'

TOC 10172'
1 jt 31.00' 10,711.72' 1/2" VAM

R Nipple 1.00· 10,712.72' 3-1/2 2.562
i jt 31.00' 10.743,72' 3-1/2" | VAM

PER 4.00' 10,747.72' 4"
Seal Assmebly 10,747.72'

MMMIMMEMIEEMMX
1-1/4" Colled tubing 6,766.00' 6,766.00'

Valve 8 6,767.00'
Valve 7 8,766.00'
Valve 6 10,166.00 Sqz holes
Valve 5 11,016.00
Valve 4 11,616.00
Valve 3 12,216.00 TÌgl1ÍSpot
Valve 2 12,716.00

11095' - 11099'
Valve 1 13,117.00

9/11/1985 13,400' 13,410 10 40 Sand Frac(48K lbs.) Fionner @ 4,764'
914111985 13,420 13,482 62 248 Sand Frac(48Klbs.} Aspen @ 5,341'
9/11/1985 13,510' 13,516' 6' 24 SandFrac(48KIbs.) BearRiver@ 6,551'
9/11/1985 13,542' 13,562' 20' 80 Sand Frac(48K Ibs.) Gannett @ 7,003'
9/11/1985 13,582' 13,613' 31' 124 Sand Frac(48K lbs.) Preuss @ 10,218'
9/11/1985 13,676' 13,690' 14' 56 SandFrac(48Klbs.) Salt@ 11,344'
9/11/1985 13,701' 13,710 9' 36 Sand Frac(48K lbs.) Twin Creek@ 11,780'

13,750' 13,768' 18 72 Nugget @ 13,618'
1/8/1984 13,776' 13,832 56 224 All 4 SPF
1/8/1984 13,861' 13,894 33 132 All 4 SPF
1/8/1984 13,924' 13,950 104 All 4 SPF
1/8/1984 13,980' 14,015 35 140 All4SPF
1/8/1984 14,030' 14,054 24 96 All 4 SPF
1/8/1984 14,081' 14,072 11 44 M 4 SPF

14,088' 14,158 70 280 All 4 SPF PBTD 14,980
9/28/1987 14,270' 14,340 70 280 All 4 SPF TD 15,466
9/28/1987 14,370' 14,S20 160 600 All4SPF
9/28/1987 14.580' 14,600 20 80 M 4

'N Wellbore DiagramMELUT ENERGY COMPANY

Lease &Well No. ARE W36-16(FKA: Island Ranch E-1) CPF Name Gas GathedngFieldName AnschutzRanch East Countv & State summitcounty,UT
Locatfori sec. 36, 4N7E A

Well Information
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PI e Data

Top Bottom Size Weight Grade Sx. Cmt Comments
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MERIT ENERGY COMPANY

ELLNAME: ARE E28-06 FIELD: ANSCHUTZ RANCH EAST
R QTR: SEC: 28 TWN: 4N RNG: 8E
UNTY: SUMMIT ST: UT SPUD DATE:

KB: 7513 GL: 7487 TD: 15170 PBTD:
LASTUPDATED: MQig3/LOS BY: MIKE MERCER

CASING DETAILS
PURPOSE SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH
SURFACE 13-3/8" 72# S95 3988'
INTERMEDIATE 9-5/8", 9-7/8" 47#, 62.8# S95 12990'
PRODUCTION 7" 32# L80 F/12313-15160
TIEBACK 7" 32# N80,S95 F/0-12313'

TUBING DETAILS
DESCRIPTION SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH
KB 26.00

TOL @12313

COLLAPSED CASING @ +/-12678'

SQZ PERFS
12991-12993

NUGGET PERFS
14250-14265
14310-14316
14325-14332
14360-14372
14380-14396
14466-14482
14500-14506
14530-14566
14594-14630
14728-14755

FISH: 2-7/8" 6.5# NBOstub, 43 jts 2-7/8" 6.5# N80, XCICR @ 14802'
.

14814-14866 Nipple, 1 jt 2-7/8" 6.5# N80, XNNipple, WL Re-entry
CICR @ 14900 guide (1410.50')
14980-14988 (SQZD)
14992-15009 (SQZD)
15018-15024
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INSPECTIONFORM6 STATEOF UTAH
DIVISIONOF OILGAS AND MINING

-

-> WELL - PRESSURE TEST

Well Name: Ë4 W2 he ta l API Number: $-03 -3p /
Qtr/Qtr: /diggi Section: Township: Range: Ÿ£
Company Name: | Ënm

Lease: State Fee Federal Indian

Inspector: pya. Date: 9 to la

InitialConditions:

Tubing - Rate: A 54tD Pressure: psi

Casing/Tubing Annulus - Pressure: psi

Conditions During Test:

Time (Minutes) Annulus Pressure Tubing Pressure
o to'·41 1000
5 lo'·92. Inao

10 lo:58 [000
15 f.o2. Ioðo
20
25

Resul s: all

Conditions After Test:

Tubing Pressure: -O' psi

Casing/Tubing Annulus Pressure: ,9"' psi

COMMENTS:

Opera or
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State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER

GARY R. HERBERT
Executive Director

covernor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GREGORY S. BELL JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Governor Division Director

June 6, 2011

Ms. Michal K. White
Merit Energy Company
13727 Noel Road, Suite 500 ·

Dallas, TX 75240

Subject: Notice of Violation: Abandoned Well Requirements for Fee or State Leases

Dear Ms. White:

The Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (the Division) is reissuing this Notice of Violation (NOV)
that originally went out via certified mail to Merit Energy Company (Merit) on July 1, 2010 (see
Attachment of original Violation). Merit was given until September 30, 2010, to respond to this NOV.
To date the Division has not received any information from Merit showing any attempt to move these
wells out of violation status.

As of January 1, 2011, Merit had twentyfive (25) wells that were in non-compliance with the
requirements for shut-in or temporarily abandoned (SI/TA) status. The Division recognizes that two (2)
wells have been plugged and abandoned (PA'd) in March of this year. However the two wells that were
PA'd were not part of this NOV. Currently Merit has twenty three (23) wells that are still in non-
compliance. Nine (9) of the 23 wells have previously been addressed in this NOV (see Attachment),
originally dated June 30, 2010. Six (6) wells have recently been issued an NOV and the remaining eight
(8) have also recently being issued a second notice of non-compliance.

Wells with five (5) years non-activity or non-productivity shall be plugged, unless the Division
grants approval for extended shut-in time upon a showing of good cause by the operator (R649-3-36-
1.3.3).

IMMEDIATE ACTION REQUIRED: Please submit information required by R649-3-36, plug
and abandon or place wells on production.

Date of service mailing: June 7, 201I
CERTIFIED MAIL No.: 7005 1820 0001 5562 9832

If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me at (801) 538-5281.

Si

Dus K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

DKD/JP/js
Enclosure
ec: Well Files uTAN

Compliance File DNR
N:\O&G Reviewed Docs\ChronFile\PetroleumEngineer\NOV

1594 West North Teinple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114 -5801

telephone (801) 538-5340 •facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • www.ogm.utah.gov oIL, GAS &
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UTAH DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

Division of 011,Gas & Mining

Oiland Gas Program
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, Box 145801

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(801) 538-5340 Phone

(801) 359-3940 Fax

NOTICE OF VIOLATION
STATE OF UTAH

OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION ACT
Akkkk***************Akkkkkkk**kk**********Akk

To the following operator:
Name: MERIT ENERGY COMPANY

Well(s) or Site(s): 1.) ARE W31-04E API #: 43-043-30165
- 2.) CHAMPLIN372 AMOCO C1 43-043-30143

3.) ARE W31-12 43-043-30190

4.) ARE W16-14 43-043-30096

5.) ARE 16-12 43-043-30231

6.) CHAMPLIN387 B1A 43-043-30168

7.) ARE W17-16 43-043-30176

8.) ARE W16-06 43-043-30138

9.) ARE W20-06 43-043-30159

10.) ARE W20-02 43-043-30228

Date and Time of InspectionNiolation: June 30, 2010

Mailing Address: Attn: Michal K. White

13727 Noel Road, Ste 500

Dallas, TX 75240

Under the authorityof the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation Act, Section 40-6 et. Seq., Utah Code Annotated,
1953, as amended, the undersigned authorizedrepresentative of the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
(Division) has conducted an inspection of theabove described site and/or records on theabove date and
has foundalleged violation(s) of the act, rules or permitconditionsas described below.

Description of Violation(s):

Rule R649-3-36, Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned We/Is -With the exception of wells 9 and 10 listed
above, the above referenced wells have been Shut-in or Temporarily Abandoned (SI/TA)over 5 consecutive
years. Wells 9 and 10 are approachinq 5 years consecutive shut-inand only produced intermittently from
2004 to 2006 after previously beinq shut-in in 2000 and 1998 respectively. According to Rule R649-3-36,
the operator is required to supply the Division with reasons for extended SIITA,the length of time for
extended SI/TAand proof ofwellbore integrity for everywellSIITAover 12 consecutivemonths. After5
years of continuedSIITA,thewellsare tobe pluqqedunless good cause is suppliedtotheDivisionfor
extended SI/TA in additionto the required information just mentioned.
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UTAHDEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
Divisionof Ofi, Gas &Mining
Oli and Gas Program

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, Box 145801

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(801) 538-5340 Phone

(801) 359-3940 Fax

The Division has initiated several contacts with Merit Energy Company (Merit) requesting required
documents and action per R649-3-36. Allwells listed above had a first notice sent out via certified mailon
Januarv 22, 2004 to Merit. Previously in 2003, BP America Production Company (Merits' predecessor) had
SlfrA requests denied on all wells listed above except well 1 and well 9. The Division accepted a plan on
April 8, 2005 for wells 1 through8 to bringthose wells back into production. After several correspondence
and accepted plans to bring wells into production, the Division issued a Third Notice on August 26, 2008.
The Division notified Merit on January 21, 2009 that the plan and submittedintegrity information was
insufficient. By letter dated August 26, 2009, Merit proposed to get proper MITdata and reactivate several
of thewells. Our records show nothing has been done to date to move these wells out of violation status.
The Division has had numerous other communications by phone and email with Merit and Merit has not
provided adequate data to prove mechanical integrity and has not followedthroughwith plans for removing
wells from the SIITAlist Merithas not compliedwith rule RS49-3-36 despite the several years the Division
has worked with Meritto bringthese wellsînto compliance. In addition tothewellssubject to thisNOV,
Merit has 15 additional wells Sl/TAbeyond 12 monthswithout approvat. Immediate action must be taken on
thosewells as well.

Action; For thewellsubject to this notice, Merit shall either submitthe information required by R649: 36,
plug and abandon or place the wells on production.

This notice shall remain in effect until it is modified, terminated,or vacated by a written notice of an
authorized representative of the director of the Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining. Failure to complywith this
notice will result in the Division pursuing further actions against said operator. Further actions may include
initiation of agency actions to order full cost bonding and plugging and abandonment of wells and requests
for bond forfeiture and civil penalties.

Compliance Deadline: September 30, 2010
Date of Service Mailing: July 1, 2010

F N 0003 0190 4543

Division's Representative Operator or Representative

(Ifpresented in person)
6/2005
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STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 MERIT ENERGY COMPANY 

9. API NUMBER:
 43043301430000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 13727 Noel Rd Ste 500 , Dallas, TX, 75240 972 628-1540  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ANSCHUTZ RANCH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0860 FNL 0536 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 23 Township: 04.0N Range: 07.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 SUMMIT 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

8/10/2010

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Merit Energy Company would like to have this well placed in Temporarily
Abandoned status. Please see attached MIT and WBD. 

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Kim Mercer 972 628-1023

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 9/1/2011

09/28/2011

Sep. 01, 2011

Sundry Number: 18045 API Well Number: 43043301430000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEEEASEDESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
MERIT ENERGY COMPANY 43043301430000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
13727 Noel Rd Ste 500 , Dallas, TX, 75240 972 628-1540 Ext ANSCHUTZ RANCH

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SUMMIT

0860 FNL 0536 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 23 Township: 04.0N Range: 07.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

8/10/2010 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL w TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR RErt
D e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Merit Energy Company would like to have this well placed in Temporarily
Abandoned status. Please see attached MIT and WBD.

REQUEST DENIED
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: 09/28/29 1

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Kim Mercer 972 628-1023 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 9/1/2011

Please Review Attached Reasons for

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEEEASEDESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
MERIT ENERGY COMPANY 43043301430000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
13727 Noel Rd Ste 500 , Dallas, TX, 75240 972 628-1540 Ext ANSCHUTZ RANCH

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SUMMIT

0860 FNL 0536 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 23 Township: 04.0N Range: 07.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

8/10/2010 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL w TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR RErt
D e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Merit Energy Company would like to have this well placed in Temporarily
Abandoned status. Please see attached MIT and WBD.

REQUEST DENIED
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: 09/28/29 1

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Kim Mercer 972 628-1023 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 9/1/2011

Please Review Attached Reasons for



  

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43043301430000

Please see requirements of R649-3-36 - request must include the reason for extended
SI/TA as well as the expected length of time to be SI/TA. Also, MIT was performed in

2010 - information should show how MIT is still valid. 

Sep. 01, 2011

Sundry Number: 18045 API Well Number: 43043301430000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources
Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

TI BASPrNINTfdG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43043301430000

Please see requirements of R649-3-36 - request must include the reason for extended
SI/TA as well as the expected length of time to be SI/TA. Also, MIT was performed in

2010 - information should show how MIT is still

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources
Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

TI BASPrNINTfdG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43043301430000

Please see requirements of R649-3-36 - request must include the reason for extended
SI/TA as well as the expected length of time to be SI/TA. Also, MIT was performed in

2010 - information should show how MIT is still



Sep. 01, 2011

Sundry Number: 18045 API Well Number: 43043301430000

3074972442 merit anschutz Merit-Anschutz 02:47:15 p.m. 08-11-2010 3 /4

INSPECTIONFORue STATEOF UTAH
DIVISIONOF OILGASANDMINING

WuEO¥IGNWELL- PRESSURE TEST

Wel1Name: / 372 Aw, / / API Number 4-o Ñ -30 /h
Qtr/Qtr; & Jda) Section: Township: S/ Range: Ÿ/'
Company Name: lyk, i

Lease: State Fee Federal Indian
inspector: Date: 9 (p /µ

InitialConditions:

Tubing - Rate: pl SGO Pressure: psi

Casing/Tubing Annulus - Pressure: 1:7" psi

Conditions During Test:

Time (Minutes) Annulus Pressure Tubing Pressure
o (o·.Vj loco
5 (O'-92. Icm

10 lo:58 LOCO
15 g·o2. loco
20
25
30

Results: all

ConditionsAfterTest:

Tubing Pressure: .O' psi

Casing/Tubing Annulus Pressure: psi

COMMENTS:

Operefor

3074972442 merit anschutz Merit-Anschutz 02:47:15 p.m. 08-11-2010 3 /4

INSPECTIONFORue STATEOF UTAH
DIVISIONOF OILGASANDMINING

WuEO¥IGNWELL- PRESSURE TEST

Wel1Name: / 372 Aw, / / API Number 4-o Ñ -30 /h
Qtr/Qtr; & Jda) Section: Township: S/ Range: Ÿ/'
Company Name: lyk, i

Lease: State Fee Federal Indian
inspector: Date: 9 (p /µ

InitialConditions:

Tubing - Rate: pl SGO Pressure: psi

Casing/Tubing Annulus - Pressure: 1:7" psi

Conditions During Test:

Time (Minutes) Annulus Pressure Tubing Pressure
o (o·.Vj loco
5 (O'-92. Icm

10 lo:58 LOCO
15 g·o2. loco
20
25
30

Results: all

ConditionsAfterTest:

Tubing Pressure: .O' psi

Casing/Tubing Annulus Pressure: psi

COMMENTS:

Operefor



Sep. 01, 2011

Sundry Number: 18045 API Well Number: 43043301430000

WELL NAME: CHAMPLIN 372 C-1 SIDETRACK
COUNTY: SUMMIT ST: UT FIELD: Anschutz Ranch TD: 8,608
QTR QTR: SEC: 23 API #: 43-043-30143 PBTD:
UPDATED: 07/23/09 TWN: 4N SPUD DATE: 04/13/98 KB: 7,002
UPDATEDBY: NICKTUNNELL RNG: 7E MAXTEMP: 137 F GL: 6,988

CASING DETAILS
PURPOSE TOC CMT SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTE
SURFACE SURF 1000 SX 9-5/8" 32.3# HMO 1,518'
INTERMEDIATE 4,906' 750 SX 7" . 23 & 26 S-95 & K 55 7,300'
TIE BACK 4-1/2" 12.6# N-80 VAM 5,090'
LINER 465 SX | 4-1/2" 12.6# N-80 VAM 5,090' - 7,849'

TUBING DETAILS
DESCRIPTION SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEFTE
TUBING 2-3/8" 4.7# EUE8RD
INFLATABLEPACKER 8,320'

Based on Sundry Notice dated 2/18/2002

PERFORATIONS
DATE TOP BOTTOM GROSS HOLES SPF

OPEN HOLE

FORMATION TOPS NOTES: HOLE IN 7" CASING - CASING PATCH SET FROM 3582 -

ASPEN 3635' in 2002.

BEARRIVER
GANNET
PREUSS 4,535'
TOP SALT 5,253'
BASESALT
TWIN CREEK 5,484'
WATTONCANYON
BOUNDRYRIDGE
RICH
SLIDEROCK
GYPSUMSPRINGS
NUGGET

WELL NAME: CHAMPLIN 372 C-1 SIDETRACK
COUNTY: SUMMIT ST: UT FIELD: Anschutz Ranch TD: 8,608
QTR QTR: SEC: 23 API #: 43-043-30143 PBTD:
UPDATED: 07/23/09 TWN: 4N SPUD DATE: 04/13/98 KB: 7,002
UPDATEDBY: NICKTUNNELL RNG: 7E MAXTEMP: 137 F GL: 6,988

CASING DETAILS
PURPOSE TOC CMT SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTE
SURFACE SURF 1000 SX 9-5/8" 32.3# HMO 1,518'
INTERMEDIATE 4,906' 750 SX 7" . 23 & 26 S-95 & K 55 7,300'
TIE BACK 4-1/2" 12.6# N-80 VAM 5,090'
LINER 465 SX | 4-1/2" 12.6# N-80 VAM 5,090' - 7,849'

TUBING DETAILS
DESCRIPTION SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEFTE
TUBING 2-3/8" 4.7# EUE8RD
INFLATABLEPACKER 8,320'

Based on Sundry Notice dated 2/18/2002

PERFORATIONS
DATE TOP BOTTOM GROSS HOLES SPF

OPEN HOLE

FORMATION TOPS NOTES: HOLE IN 7" CASING - CASING PATCH SET FROM 3582 -

ASPEN 3635' in 2002.

BEARRIVER
GANNET
PREUSS 4,535'
TOP SALT 5,253'
BASESALT
TWIN CREEK 5,484'
WATTONCANYON
BOUNDRYRIDGE
RICH
SLIDEROCK
GYPSUMSPRINGS
NUGGET



Sep. 01, 2011

Sundry Number: 18045 API Well Number: 43043301430000

M
MERlT ENERGY COMPANY

KOPAT 5614'

WHIPSTOCKAT

M
MERlT ENERGY COMPANY

KOPAT 5614'

WHIPSTOCKAT



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 MERIT ENERGY COMPANY 

9. API NUMBER:
 43043301430000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 13727 Noel Rd Ste 500 , Dallas, TX, 75240 972 628-1540  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ANSCHUTZ RANCH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0860 FNL 0536 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 23 Township: 04.0N Range: 07.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 SUMMIT 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

8/10/2011

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Merit Energy Company [MEC] would like to have this well place in Temporarily
Abandoned status for one year. MEC will need to complete a reservoir study
on the well to determine if the remaining hydrocarbons can be recovered by

offset wells or complete a workover on the well to return it to production. 

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Kim Mercer 972 628-1023

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 10/4/2011

11/16/2011

Oct. 04, 2011

Sundry Number: 19114 API Well Number: 43043301430000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEEEASEDESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
MERIT ENERGY COMPANY 43043301430000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
13727 Noel Rd Ste 500 , Dallas, TX, 75240 972 628-1540 Ext ANSCHUTZ RANCH

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SUMMIT

0860 FNL 0536 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 23 Township: 04.0N Range: 07.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

8/10/2011 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL w TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR RErt
D e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Merit Energy Company [MEC] would like to have this well place in Temporarily
Abandoned status for one year. MEC will need to complete a reservoir study
on the well to determine if the remaining hydrocarbons can be recovered by REQUEST DENIED

offset wells or complete a workover on the well to return it to production. Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: 11/16/2 1

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Kim Mercer 972 628-1023 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 10/4/2011

Please Review Attached Reasons for

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEEEASEDESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
MERIT ENERGY COMPANY 43043301430000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
13727 Noel Rd Ste 500 , Dallas, TX, 75240 972 628-1540 Ext ANSCHUTZ RANCH

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SUMMIT

0860 FNL 0536 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 23 Township: 04.0N Range: 07.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

8/10/2011 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL w TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR RErt
D e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Merit Energy Company [MEC] would like to have this well place in Temporarily
Abandoned status for one year. MEC will need to complete a reservoir study
on the well to determine if the remaining hydrocarbons can be recovered by REQUEST DENIED

offset wells or complete a workover on the well to return it to production. Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: 11/16/2 1

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Kim Mercer 972 628-1023 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 10/4/2011

Please Review Attached Reasons for



  

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43043301430000

Insufficient information provided to approve request. No showing of how integrity is still
intact from date of MIT last year to present. Also need submitted plan for work in the

future supporting the given reason for extension. Plan should include wells scheduled to
be PA'd, returned to production etc. and a timeline for those events. 

Oct. 04, 2011

Sundry Number: 19114 API Well Number: 43043301430000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources
Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

TI BAS Pr N1NTMG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43043301430000

Insufficient information provided to approve request. No showing of how integrity is still
intact from date of MIT last year to present. Also need submitted plan for work in the

future supporting the given reason for extension. Plan should include wells scheduled to
be PA'd, returned to production etc. and a timeline for those

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices
TI BA%PrNINTfdG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43043301430000

Insufficient information provided to approve request. No showing of how integrity is still
intact from date of MIT last year to present. Also need submitted plan for work in the

future supporting the given reason for extension. Plan should include wells scheduled to
be PA'd, returned to production etc. and a timeline for those



Oct. 04, 2011

Sundry Number: 19114 API Well Number: 43043301430000

3074972442 merit anschutz Merit-Anschutz 02:47:15 p.m. 08-11-2010 3 /4

INSPECTIONFORue STATEOF UTAH
DIVISIONOF OILGASANDMINING

WuEO¥IGNWELL- PRESSURE TEST

Wel1Name: / 372 Aw, / / API Number 4-o Ñ -30 /h
Qtr/Qtr; & Jda) Section: Township: S/ Range: Ÿ/'
Company Name: lyk, i

Lease: State Fee Federal Indian
inspector: Date: 9 (p /µ

InitialConditions:

Tubing - Rate: pl SGO Pressure: psi

Casing/Tubing Annulus - Pressure: 1:7" psi

Conditions During Test:

Time (Minutes) Annulus Pressure Tubing Pressure
o (o·.Vj loco
5 (O'-92. Icm

10 lo:58 LOCO
15 g·o2. loco
20
25
30

Results: all

ConditionsAfterTest:

Tubing Pressure: .O' psi

Casing/Tubing Annulus Pressure: psi

COMMENTS:

Operefor

3074972442 merit anschutz Merit-Anschutz 02:47:15 p.m. 08-11-2010 3 /4

INSPECTIONFORue STATEOF UTAH
DIVISIONOF OILGASANDMINING

WuEO¥IGNWELL- PRESSURE TEST

Wel1Name: / 372 Aw, / / API Number 4-o Ñ -30 /h
Qtr/Qtr; & Jda) Section: Township: S/ Range: Ÿ/'
Company Name: lyk, i

Lease: State Fee Federal Indian
inspector: Date: 9 (p /µ

InitialConditions:

Tubing - Rate: pl SGO Pressure: psi

Casing/Tubing Annulus - Pressure: 1:7" psi

Conditions During Test:

Time (Minutes) Annulus Pressure Tubing Pressure
o (o·.Vj loco
5 (O'-92. Icm

10 lo:58 LOCO
15 g·o2. loco
20
25
30

Results: all

ConditionsAfterTest:

Tubing Pressure: .O' psi

Casing/Tubing Annulus Pressure: psi

COMMENTS:

Operefor



Oct. 04, 2011

Sundry Number: 19114 API Well Number: 43043301430000

WELL NAME: CHAMPLIN 372 C-1 SIDETRACK
COUNTY: SUMMIT ST: UT FIELD: Anschutz Ranch TD: 8,608
QTR QTR: SEC: 23 API #: 43-043-30143 PBTD:
UPDATED: 07/23/09 TWN: 4N SPUD DATE: 04/13/98 KB: 7,002
UPDATEDBY: NICKTUNNELL RNG: 7E MAXTEMP: 137 F GL: 6,988

CASING DETAILS
PURPOSE TOC CMT SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTE
SURFACE SURF 1000 SX 9-5/8" 32.3# HMO 1,518'
INTERMEDIATE 4,906' 750 SX 7" . 23 & 26 S-95 & K 55 7,300'
TIE BACK 4-1/2" 12.6# N-80 VAM 5,090'
LINER 465 SX | 4-1/2" 12.6# N-80 VAM 5,090' - 7,849'

TUBING DETAILS
DESCRIPTION SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEFTE
TUBING 2-3/8" 4.7# EUE8RD
INFLATABLEPACKER 8,320'

Based on Sundry Notice dated 2/18/2002

PERFORATIONS
DATE TOP BOTTOM GROSS HOLES SPF

OPEN HOLE

FORMATION TOPS NOTES: HOLE IN 7" CASING - CASING PATCH SET FROM 3582 -

ASPEN 3635' in 2002.

BEARRIVER
GANNET
PREUSS 4,535'
TOP SALT 5,253'
BASESALT
TWIN CREEK 5,484'
WATTONCANYON
BOUNDRYRIDGE
RICH
SLIDEROCK
GYPSUMSPRINGS
NUGGET

WELL NAME: CHAMPLIN 372 C-1 SIDETRACK
COUNTY: SUMMIT ST: UT FIELD: Anschutz Ranch TD: 8,608
QTR QTR: SEC: 23 API #: 43-043-30143 PBTD:
UPDATED: 07/23/09 TWN: 4N SPUD DATE: 04/13/98 KB: 7,002
UPDATEDBY: NICKTUNNELL RNG: 7E MAXTEMP: 137 F GL: 6,988

CASING DETAILS
PURPOSE TOC CMT SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTE
SURFACE SURF 1000 SX 9-5/8" 32.3# HMO 1,518'
INTERMEDIATE 4,906' 750 SX 7" . 23 & 26 S-95 & K 55 7,300'
TIE BACK 4-1/2" 12.6# N-80 VAM 5,090'
LINER 465 SX | 4-1/2" 12.6# N-80 VAM 5,090' - 7,849'

TUBING DETAILS
DESCRIPTION SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEFTE
TUBING 2-3/8" 4.7# EUE8RD
INFLATABLEPACKER 8,320'

Based on Sundry Notice dated 2/18/2002

PERFORATIONS
DATE TOP BOTTOM GROSS HOLES SPF

OPEN HOLE

FORMATION TOPS NOTES: HOLE IN 7" CASING - CASING PATCH SET FROM 3582 -

ASPEN 3635' in 2002.

BEARRIVER
GANNET
PREUSS 4,535'
TOP SALT 5,253'
BASESALT
TWIN CREEK 5,484'
WATTONCANYON
BOUNDRYRIDGE
RICH
SLIDEROCK
GYPSUMSPRINGS
NUGGET



Oct. 04, 2011

Sundry Number: 19114 API Well Number: 43043301430000

M
MERlT ENERGY COMPANY

KOPAT 5614'

WHIPSTOCKAT

M
MERlT ENERGY COMPANY

KOPAT 5614'

WHIPSTOCKAT



e State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER

GARY R. HERBERT Executive Director

Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
SPENCER J. COX JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Governor Division Director

May 27, 2014

Certified Mail #7003 2260 0003 2358 6960

Arlene Valliquette i MS
North Division Regulatory Manager
Merit Energy Company
13727 Noel Road, Suite 500
Dallas, Texas 75240

Subject: Oil and Gas General Conservation Rule R649-3-36 - Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned Wells

Dear Ms. Valliqeutte:

The Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (Division) met with Merit Energy Company (Merit), at our
offices, on April 26, 2012 to discuss long term plans for Merits' shut-in wells at Anschutz Ranch Field.
The Division expressed its concerns regarding the number of shut-in wells Merit operated and the length
of time wells have been shut-in. The Division discussed the importance to timely plugging shut-in wells
that have no future value and submit extension sundries for shut-in wells that will not be immediately
plugged or returned to production. Merit representatives at the meeting indicated they understood the
Divisions' concerns. However, Merit required additional time for their engineer, newly assigned to this
area, to review the shut-in well list to determine which wells should be returned to production and which
wells should be plugged. Merit also needed to present the well review to management for budget
approval.

Merit submitted, to the Division, a written 2013 Plugging and/or Reactivation Well Plan dated
October 30, 2012. The plan stated Merit was in the process of applying for approval to convert the
Champlin 372 Amoco Cl well to a water disposal well. The plan committed to the plugging of the ARE
W31-04E, ARE W31-12, ARE Wl6-12 and ARE Wl7-16 wells by the end ofthe 2012 calendar year.
Merit also proposed probable reactivations of the ARE W20-09, ARE W20-06, ARE W20-08 and ARE
W20-12 wells and probable plugging and abandonment of the ARE W16-14 and ARE E 21-14 wells. The
results are listed below.

Champlin 372 Amoco Cl Water Disposal Well application never submitted
ARE W31-04E Plugged 1/9/2013
ARE W31-12 Plugged 1/21/2013
ARE Wl6-12 Plugged 12/3/2012
ARE Wl7-16 Plugged 11/16/2012
ARE W20-09 Reactivated April 2013
ARE W20-06 Never Reactivated
ARE W20-08 Never Reactivated
ARE W20-12 Never Reactivated
ARE Wl6-14 Plugged May 2014
ARE E21-14 Plugged April 2014

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • wwwogm.utah.gov

OIL, GAS &
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Page 2
Merit Energy Company
May 27, 2014

Ryan Huddleston from your office has indicated in recent conversations with Dustin Doucet that
Merit is preparing to reactivate/plug 6-8 more shut-in wells. To date Merit has not submitted a written
plan for Division approval.

Merit currently operates twenty-five (25) shut-in wells at Anschutz Ranch Field; see Compliance
Attachment. Eleven (11) of the twenty-five total shut-in wells were added between January 2012 and
January 2014. The Division has sent Merit several Shut-in and Temporary Abandonment Notices
describing Rule 649-3-36 Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned Well requirements. The Division denied
shut-in extension requests for seven (7) wells due to insufficient information. The Division also issued
Notices of Violation for ten (10) of the shut-in wells. Merit has not submitted shut-in extensions sundries
for the eleven wells added between January 2012 and January 2014, or submitted additional required
information for the seven denied shut-in extensions, or resolved the Notices of Violation.

The operator is responsible to file, yearly, for extended shut-in or temporary abandonment for
wells shut-in or temporarily abandoned for a period of twelve (12) consecutive months. Merit must file a
Sundry Notice providing the following information for each of the twenty-five wells listed on the
Compliance Attachment; reasons for shut-in or temporarily abandonment of the well, length of time the
well is expected to be shut-in or temporarily abandoned and an explanation and supporting data showing
the well has integrity (R649-3-36.1). After review the Division will either approve the continued shut-in
or temporarily abandoned status or require remedial action (R649-3-36.2). After five (5) years of non-
activity or non-productivity, the well shall be plugged in accordance with R649-3-24, unless approval for
extended shut-in time is given by the Division upon a showing of good cause by the operator (R649-3-
36.3). Please note, thirteen (13) of the twenty-five wells listed on the Compliance Attachment have been
shut-in over five (5) years.

Merit has until June 30, 2014 to submit sundries, for the subject wells, in accordance with Oil
and Gas Conservation General Rule 649-3-36 Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned Wells.

Should Merit not meet shut-in and temporarily abandoned well requirements, the Division is
prepared to file a Notice of Agency Action (NAA) for Commencement of Informal Adjudicative
Proceedings (R649-10-3) for this matter in accordance with Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule
R649-10 Administrative Procedures.

If you have any questions or need further assistance, please feel free to contact me at
clintondworshak@utah.gov or 801-538-5280 or Dustin Doucet, Petroleum Engineer, at dustindoucet@utah.gov
or 801-538-5281.

Sincerely,

Clinton Dworshak
Oil and Gas Compliance Manager

CLD/js
Enclosure: Compliance History

ec: John Rogers, O&G Associate Director
Dustin Doucet, Petroleum Engineer
Compliance File
Well
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Compliance History
Merit Energy Company - Anschutz Ranch Field

Charnplin 327 Amoco Last Prod 10/01 2004 SI Notice Ext Si 1/1/05 Ext SI 1/1/06 2008 SI Notice 2009 SI Notice 2010 NOV 2011NOV 2011 Denied Sl/TAsundry 2013 PLAN-SWDW
AREW16-06 Last Prod 11/96 2004 SI Notice Ext SI 1/1/05 Prod 2/05-5/05 Ext SI 1/1/06 2008 SI Notice 2009 Denied SI/TA Sundry 2010 NOV 2011 NOV
AREW20-06 Last Prod 5/00 2004 SI Notice Ext Si 1/1/05 Prod 3/2004-6/05 2008 SI Notice 2009 Denied Si/TA Sundry 2010 NOV 2011NOV 2013 Plan - Reactivate
AREW20-02 Last Prod 6/98 2004 SI Notice Ext SI 1/1/05 Prod 1/2004-6/06 2008 SI Notice 2009 Denied SI/TA Sundry 2010 NOV 2011 NOV
AREW20-12 Last Prod 3/02 Prod 9/03-3/06 Prod 6/08-7/08 2008 SI Notice 2009 Denied Sl/TA Sundry 2011NOV 2013 Plan - Reactivate
AREW30-02 Last Prod 12/01 2004 SI Notice Ext SI 1/1/05 Prod 7/05-8/07 Ext SI 1/1/06 2009 SI Notice 2010 SI Notice 2012 Denied SI/TA Sundry
AREW30-06 Last Prod 6/98 2004 SI Notice Ext SI 1/1/05 Prod 5/0-10/07 2009 SI Notice
ARE29-045T1 Last Prod 3/06 Prod 9/07-10-07 2010 SI Notice 20iioenied SI/TAsundry
AREW36-08 Last Prod 4/02 2004 SI Notice Prod 5/04-4/06 Prod 8/07-10/07 2010 SI Notice 2011SI Notice
AREW12-04 Last Prod 1/04 Prod 11/04-12/10 2011NOV
AREW20-08 Last Prod 7/08 2011 St Notice 2011NOV 2013 Plan - Reactivate
AREW30-10 Last Prod 6/08 2010 SI Notice 2011SI Notice 2011AOV
AREW21-04 Last Prod 5/97 2004 SI Notice Ext SI 1/1/05 Prod 6/04-7/08 2010 SI Notice 2011 SI Notice 2011NOV
AREW20-03 Last Prod 7/96 2004 SI Notice Ext SI 1/1/05 Prod 12/06-7/08 ExtSI 1/1/06 2010 Si Notice 2011 Si Notice 2011NOV
AREW20-04 Last Prod 7/97 2004 SI Notice Ext SI 1/1/05 Prod 1/07-5/10 Ext SI 1/1/06
AREW36-14 Last Prod 11/00 2004 SI Notice ExtSI 1/1/05 Prod 3/05-9/10 Ext 51 1/1/06
AREW11-1 Last Prod 4/96 2004 SI Notice ExtSi 1/1/05 Prod 10/06-10/10 Ext SI 1/1/06
AREW30-13 Last Prod 4/98 2004 SI Notice Ext SI 1/1/05 Prod 7/05-8/10 Prod 5/12-8/12 Ext Si 1/1/06
AREW19-16 Last Prod 3/08 2004 SI Notice ExtSI 1/1/05 Prod 10/05-1/07 Prod 12/08-5/11 Ext SI 1/1/06
AREW36 10 Last Prod 6/02 2004 SI Notice Ext Si 1/1/05 Prod 5/04-5/10

AREW36-16 Last Prod 4/07 Prod 12/08-7/10 2008 SI Notice
AREW30-14 Last Prod 1/03 Prod 5/05-8/12

AREW30-15 Last Prod 1/06 Prod 1/08-8/08 Prod 3/09-4/09
AREW20-10 Last Prod 10/08 Prod 9/09-5/10

AREW19-08 Last Prod
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RECEIVED: Jul. 08, 2014

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 MERIT ENERGY COMPANY 

9. API NUMBER:
 43043301430000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 13727 Noel Rd Ste 500 , Dallas, TX, 75240 972 628-1540  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ANSCHUTZ RANCH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0860 FNL 0536 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 23 Township: 04.0N Range: 07.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 SUMMIT 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

5 /1 /2015

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Merit Energy Company plans to Plug and Abandon the
Champlin C1 around mid 2015, depending on weather

restrictions. Please find the Procedure and WBD attached. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Ross King 972 628-1041

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 7 /8 /2014

September 18, 2014

Sundry Number: 53063 API Well Number: 43043301430000Sundry Number: 53063 API Well Number: 43043301430000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
MERIT ENERGY COMPANY 43043301430000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
13727 Noel Rd Ste 500 , Dallas, TX, 75240 972 628-1540 Ext ANSCHUTZ RANCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SUMMIT

0860 FNL 0536 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNW Section: 23 Township: 04.0N Range: 07.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

5/1/2015
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENTREPORT DEEPEN FRACTURETREAT NEWCONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Merit Energy Company plans to Plug and Abandon the Approved by the
Champlin C1 around mid 2015, depending on weather utah Division of

restrictions. Please find the Procedure and WBD attached. Oil, Gas and Mining

September 18, 2014

PleaseReviewAtladiedCuditiusofAppron\

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Ross King 972 628-1041 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 7/8/2014

RECEIVED: Jul. 08,



RECEIVED: Sep. 18, 2014

  

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43043301430000

1. Notify the Division at least 24 hours prior to conducting abandonment operations. Please call
Dan Jarvis at 801-538-5338. 

2. Amend Plug #3: This plug shall be moved downhole approximately 1150’ and balanced from
3650’ to 3000’. This will isolate casing patch/hole in casing. 

3. All annuli shall be cemented from a minimum depth of 100' to the surface. 

4. All balanced plugs shall be tagged to ensure that they are at the depth specified. 

5. Surface reclamation shall be done in accordance with R649-3-34 - Well Site Restoration. 

6. All requirements in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-24 shall apply. 

7. If there are any changes to the procedure or the wellbore configuration, notify Dustin Doucet
at 801-538-5281 (of c) or 801-733-0983 (home) prior to continuing with the procedure. 

8. All other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation general rules
shall apply. 

Sundry Number: 53063 API Well Number: 43043301430000Sundry Number: 53063 API Well Number: 43043301430000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources
Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

TI, BAS Pr NINTfdG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43043301430000

1. Notify the Division at least 24 hours prior to conducting abandonment operations. Please call
Dan Jarvis at 801-538-5338.

2. Amend Plug #3: This plug shall be moved downhole approximately 1150' and balanced from
3650' to 3000'. This will isolate casing patchlhole in casing.

3. AII annuli shall be cemented from a minimum depth of 100' to the surface.

4. AII balanced plugs shall be tagged to ensure that they are at the depth specified.

5. Surface reclamation shall be done in accordance with R649-3-34 - Well Site Restoration.

6. AII requirements in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-24 shall apply.

7. If there are any changes to the procedure or the wellbore configuration, notify Dustin Doucet
at 801-538-5281 (of c) or 801-733-0983 (home) prior to continuing with the procedure.

8. AII other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation general rules
shall apply.

RECEIVED: Sep. 18,



RECEIVED: Sep. 18, 2014

Sundry Number: 53063 API Well Number: 43043301430000Sundry Number: 53063 API Well Number: 43043301430000

9/9/2014 Wellbore Diagram r263

API Well No: 43-043-30143-00-00 Permit No: Well Name/No: CHAMPLIN 372 AMOCO C 1
Company Name: MERIT ENERGY COMPANY

Location: See: 23 T: 4N R: 7E Spot: NWNW String Information
Coordinates: X: 489051 Y: 45468 16 Bottom Diameter Weight Length

String (ft sub) (inches) (Ib/ft) (ft)Field Name: ANSCHUTZ RANCH

County Name: SUMM.lT -
OO

18 .25

SURF 1518 9.625 x 7^ 32.3 NE -7 2(o
-BOL2 7300 8.75 N " to . 133 ( 4. 'O OD 7300 7 26 e .Lif/2

Conductor: 16 in. @74 ft.
IlÇL3 8608 6.125

Surface: 9.625 in. @ 1518 ft
5090 4.5 12.6

Hole: Unknown Ll 7849 4.5 12.6 C er gf 2 //- 9Ÿ
Cement from 1518 ft to surface PKR 5090 4.5

niediate:4.5 in. @5090 ft. Tl 8320 2.375
PKR 8320Hole: 12.25 in. @1518 ft.

Cement Information
BOC TOC

String (ft sub) (ft sub) Class Sacks
Ll 7849 5090 35 465P rett 39 82.'

//Ut6 3(a/2'
PROFD "/300 4906 UKK 7500

Perforation Information
Top Bottom

(ft sub) (ft sub) Shts/Ft No Shts Dt Squeeze
6221 7072

Liner fro 849 ft to 5107 11,

Í3A/ORG. Cement from 7300 ft to 4906 ft.
Formation Information

Packer: @8320 ft Formation Depth
Tubing: 2.375 in. @8320 ft. PREUS 4535

SALT 5253Production: 7 in. @7300 ft
TWNCR 5484AIGCD '703 Hole: 8.75 in. @7300 ft
BNDRG 6590
GYPSP 6960

P '&10 '

7032

Hole: 6.125 in. @8608 ft tr/2
' sto / tsXe en sx

TD: 8608 TVD: 6648 PBTD:



RECEIVED: Jul. 08, 2014

Champlin 372 C  

API #: 43-043-30143 
 

Current Status: Shut-in 

Future Plan: Plug and Abandon (PA) – Procedure Attached 

Reason: Well has only made water and has been shut-in multiple times for water production, 

was sidetracked in 1998 but still a water producer. Has spent more time shut in that producing. Is 

open in Twin Creek shut in for low production and high water. 

OPERATIONAL PROCEDURE CHAMPLIN 372 C-1 
 

1. Test anchors.  MIRUSU. 
2. ND WH and NU BOP. 
3. TOOH with 2 3/8” ”tbg. 
4. Pull 5,090' of 4 1/2" tie back string. 
5. MIRU E-line and run GR/JB to 5,600’.  POOH and PU 4 1/2” CIBP, RIH and 

set CIBP @ 5,600’. 
6. TIH to CIBP.  Circulate gas/oil out of hole.  SI backside and pressure test 

casing to 500 psi.  If casing does not test P/U packer & locate casing leaks. 
7. If casing tests, spot 624' cement to cover CIBP & liner top. 
8. POOC pump 9 ppg gel to 2,500'  Spot 125 sx balanced cement stabilizer. 
9. RU wireline and shoot 4 holes in the prod casing 50’ below the surface shoe 

at 1,568’. 
10. PU CICR, RIH and set 50’ above perfs @ 1,518’. 
11. Dig out and expose 9 5/8” surface valve and open.   
12. Establish circulation up annulus through retainer.  
13. After gaining circulation, pump cement sufficient for 100’ annular volume (50’ 

in and out plug) plus casing volume from retainer to perfs.   
14. Sting out of retainer and spot 100’ cement on top of CICR. 
15. POOC pump 9 ppg gel to 100’ 
16. TOOH, ND BOP and RDSU.  
17. Dig out and cut wellhead 3’ below ground level. 
18. Run in with 1” poly pipe to 100’ and circulate cement to surface in production 

casing. 
19. Fill 9 5/8” w/100’ cement using poly pipe. 
20. Weld on dry hole plate w/ legal ID.  Backfill cellar. 

 
 

Sundry Number: 53063 API Well Number: 43043301430000Sundry Number: 53063 API Well Number: 43043301430000

Champlin 372 C
API #: 43-043-30143

Current Status: Shut-in
Future Plan: Plug and Abandon (PA) - Procedure Attached
Reason: Well has only made water and has been shut-in multiple times for water production,
was sidetracked in 1998 but still a water producer. Has spent more time shut in that producing. Is
open in Twin Creek shut in for low production and high water.

OPERATIONAL PROCEDURE CHAMPLIN 372 C-1

1. Test anchors. MIRUSU.
2. ND WH and NU BOP.
3. TOOH with 2 3/8" "tbg.
4. Pull 5,090' of 4 1/2" tie back string.
5. MIRU E-line and run GR/JB to 5,600'. POOH and PU 4 1/2" CIBP, RIH and

set CIBP @5,600'.
6. TlH to CIBP. Circulate gasloil out of hole. SI backside and pressure test

casing to 500 psi. Ifcasing does not test P/U packer & locate casing leaks.
7. Ifcasing tests, spot 624' cement to cover CIBP & liner top.
8. POOC pump 9 ppg gel to 2,500' Spot 125 sx balanced cement stabilizer.
9. RU wireline and shoot 4 holes in the prod casing 50' below the surface shoe

at 1,568'.
10.PU CICR, RIH and set 50' above perfs @ 1,518'.
11. Dig out and expose 9 5/8" surface valve and open.
12. Establish circulation up annulus through retainer.
13. After gaining circulation, pump cement sufficient for 100' annular volume (50'

in and out plug) plus casing volume from retainer to perfs.
14.Sting out of retainer and spot 100' cement on top of CICR.
15. POOC pump 9 ppg gel to 100'
16.TOOH, ND BOP and RDSU.
17. Dig out and cut wellhead 3' below ground level.
18.Run in with 1" poly pipe to 100' and circulate cement to surface in production

casing.
19. Fill9 5/8" w/100' cement using poly pipe.
20.Weld on dry hole plate w/ legal ID. Backfill cellar.

RECEIVED: Jul. 08,



RECEIVED: Jul. 08, 2014

WELL NAME:

COUNTY: ST: TD: 8,608'

QTR QTR: SEC: PBTD:

UPDATED: TWN: KB: 7,001'

UPDATED BY: RNG: GL: 6,988'

CASING DETAILS

PURPOSE TOC CMT

SURFACE SURF 1000 SX

INTERMEDIATE 4,906' 750 SX

TIE BACK 

LINER 465 SX

TUBING DETAILS

Based on Sundry Notice dated 2/28/2002

PERFORATIONS

DATE

OPEN HOLE Nugget

Original Hole

1981 Twin Creek

1981 Nugget

Retainer @ 6,051'

GYPSUM SPRINGS

FORMATION TOPS NOTES:  HOLE IN 7" CASING - CASING PATCH SET FROM 3582' - 

3635' in 2002.ASPEN

BEAR RIVER

GANNET

PREUSS 4,535'

TOP SALT 5,253'

BASE SALT

TWIN CREEK 5,484'

SLIDE ROCK

6,155' 6,980'

7,056' 7,098'

NUGGET 7,740'

WATTON CANYON

BOUNDRY RIDGE

RICH

TOP BOTTOM GROSS HOLES SPF

7,850' 8,608'

TUBING 2-3/8" 4.7# EUE 8RD

INFLATABLE PACKER 8,320'

DESCRIPTION SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH

5,090'

4-1/2" 12.6# N-80 VAM 5,090' - 7,849'

SET DEPTH

9-5/8" 32.3# H-40 1,518'

7" 23 & 26# S-95 & K-55 7,300'

SIZE WEIGHT GRADE

CHAMPLIN 372 C-1 SIDETRACK

SUMMIT UT FIELD: Anschutz Ranch

4-1/2" 12.6# N-80 VAM

Max Berglund 7E MAX TEMP: 137 ˚F

23 API #: 43-043-30143

06/04/14 4N SPUD DATE: 04/13/98

Sundry Number: 53063 API Well Number: 43043301430000Sundry Number: 53063 API Well Number: 43043301430000

WELL NAME: CHAMPLIN 372 C-1 SIDETRACK

COUNTY: SUMMIT ST: UT FIELD: Anschutz Ranch TD: 8,608'
QTR QTR: SEC: 23 API #: 43-043-30143 PBTD:
UPDATED: 06/04/14 TWN: 4N SPUD DATE: 04/13/98 KB: 7,001'

UPDATED BY: Max Berglund RNG: 7E MAX TEMP: 137 F GL: 6,988'

CASING DETAILS
PURPOSE TOC CMT SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH
SURFACE SURF 1000 SX 9-5/8" 32.3# H-40 1,518'

INTERMEDIATE 4,906 750 SX 7" 23 & 26# S-95 & K-55 7,300'
TIE BACK 4-1/2" 12.6# N-80 VAM 5,090'
LINER 465 SX 4-1/2" 12.6# N-80 VAM 5,090' -7,849'

TUBING DETAILS
DESCRIPTÏON SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTH
TUBING 2-3/8" 4.7# EUE8RD
INFLATABLEPACKER 8,320'

I I
Based on Sundry Notice dated 2/28/2002

PERFORATIONS
DATE TOP BOTTOM GROSS HOLES SPF
PEN HOLE Nuggs 7,850' 8,608'

Original Hole
1981 Twin Creek 6,155' 6,980'
1981 Nugget 7,056' 7,098'

I I
FORMATION TOPS NOTES: HOLE IN 7" CASING - CASING PATCH SET FROM 3582' -

ASPEN 3635' in 2002.

BEAR RIVER

GANNET
PREUSS 4,535'

TOP SALT 5,253'
BASE SALT

TWIN CREEK 5,484'
WATTON CANYON

BOUNDRYRIDGE
RICH

SLIDEROCK
GYPSUM SPRINGS
NUGGET 7,740'

Retainer i

RECEIVED: Jul. 08,



RECEIVED: Jul. 08, 2014

Champlin 372 C

Apr-82

Feb-92

Feb-98

May-98

Feb-02

Mar-03

Aug-10

KOP AT 5614' 

WHIPSTOCK AT 5624'

Retainer @ 6,051'

DV TOOL. 7" @ 11836'

Drill and Complete well

Well SI due to high water

Cut 2-3/8" tubing at 6,071'. Set retainer at 6,051' and squeeze cement, tag Toc at 6,018'

Set whipstock and drill out to 8,600' and log well. RIH with 4.5" liner and set 5,090'-7,850'

Set casing patch at 3,615' to repair hole. Install 4.5" tieback run to liner top at 5,090'

Passed MIT with packer in well at 8,320'

Well SI due to high water

Champlin 372C-1 Well History

Sundry Number: 53063 API Well Number: 43043301430000Sundry Number: 53063 API Well Number: 43043301430000

Ci pli i 37 C

Champlin 372C-1 Well History
Apr-82 Drill and Complete well

Feb 92 Well SI due to high water
Feb-98 Cut 2-3/8" tubingat 6,071 Set retainer at 6,051' and squeeze cement, tag Toc at 6,018'
May 98 Set whipstock and drilloutto 8,600' and log well RIH with 4.5" liner and set 5,090 7,850'
Feb-02 Set casing patch at 3,615' to repair hole Install 4 5" tiebackrun to liner top at 5,090'
Mar-03 Well SI due to high water
Aug-10 Passed MITwith packer in well at 8,320'

@ 6,051

I
I

O DV TOOL 7" @ 11836

RECEIVED: Jul. 08,
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