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WOLVERINE OPERATING COMPANY OF UTAH, LLC

Energy Exploration in Partnership with the Environment

WOLVERINE /

June 25, 2008
RECEIVED

Mr. Gil Hunt
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining 30 No
P.O. Box 145801 DIV.0FOlL,GAS&M¾NG
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Re: Application for Permit to Drill - Wolverine Operating Company of Utah, LLC
Plateau Valley Federal 35-1
NE/4 NE/4, Section 35, T25S, RIW, SLB&M
Sevier County, Utah

Dear Mr. Hunt:

Wolverine Operating Company of Utah, LLC (Wolverine) hereby submits a copy of an
Application for Permit to Drill (APD) for the referenced well. Included with this APD is the
following supplemental information:

- R649-3-2 Exception Plat showing proposed BHL;
- BLM Surface Use Plan of Operations;
- Survey Plat;
- Drilling Plan and BOPE diagram;
- Location Layout, and Pad Cross-Section Drawings;
- Vicinity Map

An H2S Contingency Plan, per Onshore Order 6, will be forthcoming as a part of this APD.

The Burrville Irrigation Company (User Number 61-2175) will be the source for water during
drilling and completion operations on this proposed well. The surface at the planned drill site
is administered by the Bureau of Land Management.

The proposed location is within 460' of a drilling unit boundary, so a request for exception to
spacing (R649-3-2) is hereby requested for the well based on restrictive topography relative to
and the need to drill at an optimum structural location. Wolverine is the only owner and
operator within 460' of the proposed well location.

Wolverine Operating Company of Utah, LLC
1140 N Centennial Park Drive. Richfield, Utah 84701. Phone: 435-896-1943, Fax:
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Please accept this letter as Wolverine's written request for confidential treatment of all
information contained in and relating to this application and proposed well.

Thank you for consideration of this application. Please feel free to contact myself or Paul
Spiering of this office if you have any questions or need additional information.

Sincerely,

Charlie Irons
Senior Landman

Wolverine Operating Company of Utah, LLC
1140 N Centennial Park Drive. Richfield, Utah 84701. Phone: 435-896-1943, Fax:
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Fonn3160-3 FORMAPPROVED
(August2007) OMBNo.1004-0137

ExpiresJuly31, 2010
UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. LeaseSerialNo.
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

UTU-81364

6 If Indian,Alloteeor TribeName
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER N/A

O O 7 IfUnitor CA Agreement, Name and No.la. Typeof work: / DRILL REENTER
N/A

8. LeaseNameand Wel1No.
Ib. Typeof Well: Oil Well O GasWel Gother SingleZone MultipleZone Plateau Valley Federal 35-1

2. Nameof Operator 9. API WellNo.
Wolverine Operating Company of Utah, LLC l. -Q Ô Ô

3a. Address 1140 N Centennial Park Drive 3b. PhoneNo.(include area code) 10. Fieldand Pool,or Exploratory
Richfield, Utah 84701 435-896-1943 Exploratory

4. Locationof Well(Report location clearly andin accordancewith any Staterequirements.*) 11.Sec.,T. R.M. or Blk.andSurveyor Area

At surface 868' FNL, 734' FEL, being in NE4NE4 Section 35, T25S, R1W, SLB&M

At proposed prod.zone 868' FNL, 734' FEL, being in NE4NE4

14. Distancein miles anddirectionfromnearest townorpost office* 12. Countyor Parish 13. State
2 miles north of Burrville, Utah Sevier UT

15. Distancefromproposed*
734' 16. No.of acres inlease 17. SpacingUnitdedicatedtothiswell

locationtonearest
property or leaseline,ft. 1,650
(Alsotonearest drig unit line,if any) 40 acres

18. Distancefrompro osed location* None 19. ProposedDepth 20. BLM/BIABond No. on file
appnlerd

fo o this
linagompleted, 14,000' (14,000' TVD) BLMWY3329

21. Elevations(Showwhether DF,KDB, RT, GL,etc.) 21 Approximatedatework will start* 23. Estimatedduration
7,883.0 GR 10/01/2008 120 days

24. Attachments
Thefollowing,completed inaccordance with therequirements of Onshore Oiland GasOrderNo.1, must be attached to thisform:

1. Wellplatcertified bya registeredsurveyor. 4. Bondto cover the operations unless covered by an existing bondon file (see
2 ADrillingPlan. Item20 above).

3. A SurfaceUse Plan (if the locationis on NationalForestSystemLands,the 5. Operatorcertification
SUPO must be filed theappropriate ForestServiceOffice). 6. Suchothersite specificinformationand/or plansas may be required bythe

BLM.

25. Signature Name(Printed/Typed) Date
Paul Spiering 06/25/2008

Title
District Land Man

App Name(Printed'Typed) Date

- BRADLEYC. I IILLTitle 0SVIRONMENTAL
MANAGER

Applicationapproval doesnot warrantor certifythat theapplicantholdslegalorequitabletitletothoserights inthesubjectleasewhichwould entitletheapplicantto
conductoperationsthereon.
Conditionsof approval,if any,areattached.

Title 18U.S.C.Section1001andTitle43 U.S.C.Section1212,make it a crime forany personknowinglyand willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the United
Statesany false,fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

(Continued on page 2) *(Instructions on page 2)

DIV OF OlL, GAS &
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SURFACE USE PLAN OF OPERATIONS

For inclusion with ApplicationforPermit to Drill

Name of Operator: Wolverine Operating Company of Utah, LLC
Address: 1140 N Centennial Park Plaza

Richfield, Utah 84701

Plateau Valley Federal 35-1
Well Location: 868' FNL & 734' FEL, (being in NE/4 NE/4)

Section 35, T25S, R1W, SLB&M
Sevier County, Utah

Access Road Location: Access road is to be an upgrade and reconstruction of an existing
Class D county road/trail across BLM land in Section 26 into the
NE4NE4 of Section 35.

State surface use is not required for any portion of the operations. Federal surface use is being
requested with the associated Application for Permit to Drill (APD) through the BLM - Richfield
Field Office.

The dirt contractor will be provided with an approved copy of the surface use plan of operations and
conditions of approval before initiating construction.

A Federal onsite inspection is scheduled for Wednesday, June 25, 2008.

Existing Roads:
The vicinity map in the APD packet shows the proposed well location and its proximity to the town of Burrville,
Utah (being about 2 miles north of same).

Driving directions: From Sigurd, Utah, travel southerly on SR 24, under Utah Department of Transportation
(UDOT) maintenance approximately 22.5 miles to SR 62 (also under UDOT maintenance), follow SR 62 southwest
about 1.6 miles to its intersection with Bear Valley Road (a county-maintained Class B paved road), proceed north
about 1.2 miles to the center of Burrville and the end of pavement, then travel northerly about 3.8 miles on Bear
Valley Road (a county-maintained Class B dirt road) to the power line road (a county-maintained Class B dirt road)
that runs northeasterly, thence southerly about 2.5 miles to the lease road.

The surface conditions of Bear Valley road and the power line road are generally adequate to bear rig-related traffic,
but certain portions will need upgrade and improvement, to an extent determined by weather and season of
operations. This will be performed under the conditions of an encroachment permit from Sevier County.

Access Roads to be Constructed and Reconstructed:
Proposed access will require the reconstruction and partial realignment of an existing R.S. 2477 road a distance of
about 1.3 miles. The reconstructed road across BLM land will include five vehicle turnouts, to allow opposing
traffic to pass.

Total length of reconstructed and improved access road is about 1.3 miles. All construction is to be on lease and no
federal right-of-way is required.

Road construction, operation and maintenance will be in compliance with the terms and conditions of the Conditions
of Approval, the American Association of State Highway and Transportation (AASHTO) safety standards, and will
meet criteria for the Manual of Uniform Traffic Control Devices (MUTCD) manual for signs.

Energy dissipating structures and silt fences will be utilized to minimize erosion that may result from the road
reconstruction.
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All existing county roads and the lease road will be maintained and kept in good repair during all phases of
operation. Vehicle operators will obey posted speed restrictions and observe safe speeds commensurate with road
and weather conditions.

Location of Existing Wells within a one-mile radius :
There are no wells (oil, gas, water, injection or disposal, producing or being drilled) within a one-mile radius of the
proposed location.

Location of Existing and/or Proposed Facilities if Well is Productive:
(a) On well pad-A temporary testing facility may be constructed on this location in the event drilling is successful,
consisting of treater/separator, tanks and related components. The facility would be surrounded by a dike of
sufficient capacity to contain the storage capacity of the largest tank. All loading lines and valves would be located
inside the berm surrounding the tank battery.
(b) Offwell pad- It is not possible to know whether an off-well pad production facility would be necessary in the

event of a discovery. The Operator will submit this information for approval at such time as production
requirements are known.

Location and Type of Water Supply (Rivers, Creeks, Lakes, Ponds and Wells):
The Operator intends to lease water for drilling purposes from the Burrville Irrigation Company, user number 61-
2175. Water will be loaded from a pipeline valve on the west side of Bear Valley Road in the SW4SE4 Section 35-
T25S-RlW, and transported by tankers to the location, using county roads and the approved lease road. Should
additional water sources be pursued they will be properly permitted through the State of Utah - Division of Water
Rights. The BLM will be notified of any changes in water supply.

Construction Materials:
Natural earth materials used for fill on the well pad will be taken from cuts made in construction of the pad.
Imported granular borrow from an approved source will be applied to the surfàce of the well pad and access road
where deemed necessary. No construction materials will be removed from federal lands.

Methods for Handling WasteDisposal:

The reserve pit will be used for the disposal of waste mud and drill cuttings. All borehole fluids and salts will be
contained in the reserve pit. It will be located in cut material and will be lined with 12 mil minimum thickness
plastic nylon reinforced liner material. The liner will overlay a felt liner pad only if sharp rock edges result from
excavation. The pit liner will overlap the top of the pit walls and be covered with dirt and/or rocks to hold it in place.
No trash, scrap pipe, etc. that could puncture the liner will be disposed of in the pit. Pit walls will be sloped no
greater than 2:1. A minimum 2-foot freeboard will be maintained in the pit at all times during the drilling and
completion operations. After evaporation of fluids, back-fill of sub-soil and compaction to prevent settling will
occur within 90 days of cessation of pit use. If necessary, any remaining fluids will be pumped out of the pit and
transported off site.

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA Title III (hazardous materials) in an amount greater than 10,000
pounds will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling, testing, or
completion of the well. Furthermore, no extremely hazardous substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold
planning quantities, will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling,
testing, or completion of the well.

Wastewater will not be discharged on the surface at this site and the drilling of the well will not require a wastewater
management plan.

All rubbish and debris will be kept in containers on the well site, and will be hauled to an approved disposal site
upon completion of drilling operations and as needed during such operations. There will be no chemical disposal of
any type.

Self-contained, portable toilets will be used for human waste, and the waste will be disposed at an approved human
waste disposal facility. Sanitation will comply with local and state regulations.

Ancillary Facilities:
No ancillary facilities are anticipated at this time.



O O
WellSite Layout:
Pad Location and Layout Drawings in the APD packet show the proposed well site layout including location of the
reserve pit and access road onto the pad, turnaround areas, parking areas, living facilities, soil material stockpiles,
and the orientation of the rig with respect to the pad and other facilities. Cross section sheets in said packet show
cuts and fills required for construction, and their relationship to topography. As detailed above under Methods for
Handling Waste Disposal, the reserve pit will be lined and appropriate measures as described above will be taken to
prevent leakage. The pit will be fenced on three sides during drilling operations and then the fourth side will be
immediately fenced when the rig is moved off location.
The pad and road designs are consistent with BLM specifications.

A pre-construction meeting with responsible company representative and contractors will be conducted at the
project site prior to commencement of surface-disturbing activities. The pad and road will be construction-staked
(centerline and exterior boundaries) prior to this meeting.
All surface disturbing activities will be supervised by a qualified, responsible company representative who is aware
of the terms and conditions of approval from the BLM under the APD.

All cut and fill slopes will be such that stability can be maintained for the life of the activity.
The stockpiled topsoil (first 6 inches or maximum available) will be isolated in a berm by the well pad. Topsoil will
be stockpiled for reclamation in such a way as to prevent soil loss and contamination.
Water spraying may be implemented if necessary to minimize dust.

Plans for Reclamation of the Surface:
Interim Reclamation: In the event production is achieved the Operator will perform interim reclamation of the site.
Interim reclamation will consist of reclamation of the reserve pit and reclamation of that portion of the well pad not
needed for ongoing operations. After evaporation of fluids, the pit will be back-filled with sub-soil and/or rock and
compacted to prevent settling. The pit area will be surfaced with granular borrow to render it a usable part of the
well pad. All portions of the pad no longer necessary for well workover, testing or treating will be contoured to
match the surrounding terrain to the best extent practicable. Stockpiled topsoil will be evenly distributed thereon,
scarified and seeded as per BLM conditions of approval.

Final Reclamation: In the event the well is a dry hole, or at such time that all production ceases and the well has
been plugged and abandoned, the Operator will perform final reclamation of the site. Final reclamation will consist
of reclamation of the reserve pit and the well pad. The reconstructed lease road will be left as is, by prior policy
agreement between the operator, the BLM, and Sevier County. Sevier County will have the option of applying to
the BLM for a Title V right-of-way to establish the lease road as a county road.

Any accumulation of hydrocarbons in the reserve pit will be removed and recovered for sale unless it is determined
by the authorized officer to be waste oil. All waste oil will be disposed of properly at approved facilities. The
portion of the reserve pit liner which is exposed above the cuttings will be cut and removed from the site and
disposed in an authorized landfill. After evaporation of fluids, the pit will be back-filled with subsoil and/or rock
from the reserve pit stockpile and compacted to prevent settling.

Road base material used in the construction of the drill pad will be removed from the site and disposed in a proper
manner. If the reserve pit has adequate capacity, then some or all of the road base material may be buried in the
reserve pit, provided that the granular is not contaminated by oil or other waste materials.
Subsoil from the portions of the well pad that are fill will be pulled up onto the pad in order to reestablish the
original slope to the best extent possible. The portions that are cut will be filled to match the original slope of the
land to the best extent possible. Topsoil from the stockpile will then be evenly distributed over the entire impacted
area, including the new-construction portion of the access road. The entire impacted area will be scarified and
seeded in late fall, using the seed mix and methods described in BLM conditions of approval. Final reclamation will
take place within 180 days after plugging date of the last well on site, depending on weather, season and other
extenuating circumstances.

During the life of the project and until the site is released from liability for reclamation, the project will be inspected
at least annually for noxious weeds. If invasive noxious weeds are found, the weeds will be treated to eliminate
further reproduction, and treatment shall continue until the weeds have been eradicated. If noxious weeds are found,
the BLM will be notified of their occurrence.
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Surface Ownership:
The surface of the proposed well site and the lease road is federally owned and is administered by the Bureau of
Land Management, United States Department of Interior.

Other Information:
The top 6 inches of soil material will be stripped and removed from the drill pad and stockpiled for future
reclamation of the site. This topsoil shall be stockpiled separately from any other excavated materials. It will be
reserved for reclamation and not utilized for any other purpose. If it is stockpiled for more than one year it will be
seeded with a seed mix approved by the authorized officer.

Heavy equipment used to construct and rehabilitate the well pad and access road will be cleaned and/or sprayed to
remove any noxious or invasive weeds and seeds, prior to entering to the project site. Any other equipment and
vehicles that have been used in other locations where noxious weeds or seeds could have attached to the equipment
will also be sprayed and/or cleaned.

All equipment and vehicles will be confined to the access road and well pad.

Western Land Services will conduct a Class III archeological survey and will submit same under separate cover to
the appropriate agencies.

Western Land Services has conducted a wildlife study in coordination with the BLM. Western will prepare an EA
for the proposed operation.

No stream alteration or drainage crossings are involved that require additional State or Federal approval.

All permanent structures, including pumping units, constructed or installed will be painted a flat, non-reflective
color as described on page 40 of the Gold Book (Surface Operating Standards and Guidelines for Oil and Gas
Exploration and Development, 4th Edition 2006). Permanent structures are defined as being on location for six
months or longer. Facilities required to comply with Occupational Safety and Health Act (OSHA) shall be
excluded.

Fire suppression equipment will be available to suppress any wildfires caused by construction or related activities.
In the event of a wildfire the Sevier County Fire Warden will be notified.
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Operator Certification

I hereby certify that I, or someone under my direct supervision, have inspected the drill site and access route
proposed herein; that I am familiar with the conditions which currently exist; that I, or someone under my direct
supervision, have full knowledge of state and Federal laws applicable to this operation; that the statements made in
this APD package are, to the best of my knowledge, true and correct; and that the work associated with the
operations proposed herein will be performed in conformity with this APD package and the terms and conditions
under which it is approved. I also certify that I, or the company I represent, am responsible for the operations
conducted under this application. These statements are subject to the provisions of 18 U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of
false statements.

Executed this 25th day of June, 2008.

Signature:
Paul Spiering

Position Title: District Land Manager

Address: Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC
1140 N Centennial Park Drive
Richfield, Utah 84701

Telephone: 435-896-1943

Field representative (same as above signatory)

Paul Spiering
Address: 1140 N Centennial Park Drive

Richfield, Utah 8470 1

Telephone: 435-896-1943

Agents not directly employed by the operator must submit a letter fromthe operator authorizing that agent to act or
file this application on their behalf
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DRILLING PLAN

Plateau Valley Federal 35-1
NE/4 NE/4 Section 35, Township 25 South, Range 1 West, S.L.B & M.

Sevier County, Utah

Plan Summary:

It is planned to drill this confidential exploration well as a vertical bore hole in accordance with the enclosed
directional drilling plan. The well will be drilled to a measured depth of 14,000' (14,000' TVD) to test the
Kaibab formation. Well path deviation caused by subsurface geologic irregularities is expected to be the
primary drilling concern in this area. No abnormal pressure is anticipated.
The planned location is as follows:

Surface Location: 868' FNL, 734' FEL, Section 35, T25S, RlW, S.L.B. & M.
Bottom Hole Location @top target (Navajo) 868' FNL, 734' FEL, Section 35, T25S, RIW, S.L.B. & M
Bottom Hole Location @total depth 868' FNL, 734' FEL, Section 35, T25S, RlW, S.L.B. & M

Conductor casing will be set at approximately 120 feet and cemented to surface. A 17-1/2" hole will be drilled
vertically to approximately 3000' where 13-3/8" surface casing will be set and cemented to surface. A 12-1/4"
hole will be drilled vertically to 8800' (8800' TVD) where the well will be logged and 9-5/8" intermediate
casing will be set and cemented to 2700' (13-3/8" csg shoe). An 8-l/2" hole will be drilled vertically to total
depth of 14000' (14000' TVD). The hole will again be logged and a 5-1/2" production liner set from total depth
of 14000' to top of liner at approximately 8500' (300' overlap in 9-5/8"). The liner will be cemented in place.

Drilling activities at this well are expected to commence as early as September, 2008 if regulatory approvals are



OXY USA Inc.
Drilling Program
Federal Plateau Valley 35-1

Well Name: Plateau Valley Federal 35-1

Surface Location: 868' FNL, 734' FEL
NE/4 NE/4 Section 35, T25S, RlW, S.L.B. & M.
Sevier County, Utah

TD Bottom-Hole Location: 868' FNL, 734' FEL

Elevations (est): 7883' GL, 7913' KB

I. Geology:

Tops of important geologic markers and anticipated water, oil, gas, and mineral content are as follows:

Pressure
Formation TVD Interval (KB) MD Interval (KB) Contents Gradient

Arapien 26' - 7450' 26' - 7450'
Twin Creek 7450' - 7750' 7450' - 7750' Oil & water 0.44 psi/ft
Navajo 7750' -9550' 7750' -9550' Oil & water 0.44 psi/ft
Chinle 9550' - 10060' 9550' - 10060'
Moenkopi 10060' - I1615' 10060' - 11615'
Sinbad Member 11615' - 11980' 11615' - 11980'
Black Dragon 11980' - 12910' 11980' - 12910'
Kaibab 12910' - 13290' 12910' - 13290' Oil & water 0.44 psi/ft
Toroweap 13290' - 13510' 13290' - 13510' Oil & water 0.44 psi/ft
White Rim 13510' - 14000' 13510' - 14000' Oil & water 0.44 psi/ft

Total Depth 14000' 14000'

II. Well Control:

The contracted drilling rig has a 10M BOP system but conditions only require a 5M BOP system. BOPE
will be in place and tested as a 5M system prior to drilling out the surface casing shoe. See attached
schematic of BOPE.

A. The BOPE will, as a minimum, include the following:

Wellhead Equipment (5M Min.):
BOPE Item Flange Size and Rating
Annular Preventer 13-5/8" 5M
Double Rams (5" Pipe - top, Blind - bottom) 13-5/8" 10M
Drilling Spool w/ 2 side outlets (4" Choke Line, 4" Kill Line) 13-5/8" 10M x 13-5/8" 10M
Single Ram (Pipe) 13-5/8" 10M
Spacer Spool 13-5/8" 10M x 13-5/8" 10M
Casing Spool (Multi-Bowl) 13-5/8" 10M x 13-5/8" 5M
Casing Head (13-3/8" SOW w/ two 2-1/16" SSO's) 13-5/8" 5M

Auxiliary Equipment (5M Min.):
PE Item

Choke Line with 2 valves (3" minimum)
Kill Line with 2 valves and one check valve (2" Minimum)
2 Chokes with one remotely controlled at a location readily accessible to the driller
Safety Valves to fit all drill string connections in



OXY USA Inc.
Drilling Program
Federal Plateau Valley 35-1

Inside BOP or float sub
Pressure gauge on choke manifold
Fill-up line above the uppermost preventer
Wear bushing in casing head

B. Choke manifold will be functionally equipped and sized at a minimum as shown on the attached
diagram. All choke lines will be straight lines unless turns have tee blocks or are targeted with running
tees, and all choke lines will be anchored. All valves (except chokes) in the kill line choke manifold
and choke line will be full opening and allow straight through flow.

C. System accumulator will have sufficient capacity to open the hydraulically-controlled gate valve and
close all rams plus the annular preventer (3 ram system will have added 50 percent safety factor to
compensate for any fluid loss in the control system or preventers) and retain a minimum pressure of
200 psi above pre-charge on the closing manifold without use of the closing unit pumps. The fluid
reservoir capacity shall be double the usable fluid volume of the accumulator system capacity and the
fluid level of the reservoir shall be maintained at the manufacturer's recommendations. The
accumulator will have two (2) independent power sources available to close the preventers. Nitrogen
bottles may be one of those sources, and if so, will have charge maintained per manufacturer's
specifications.

D. Accumulator pre-charge pressure test will be conducted prior to connecting the closing unit to the
BOP stack and at least once every 6 months. The accumulator pressure will be corrected if the
measured precharge pressure is found to be above or below the maximum or minimum specified limits.
Only nitrogen gas will be used to precharge.

E. Power for the closing unit pumps will be available to the unit at all times so that the pumps will
automatically start when the closing valve manifold pressure has decreased to the pre-set level.

F. Accumulator pump capacity will be such that, with the accumulator system isolated from service, the
pumps will be capable of opening the hydraulically-operated gate valve (if so equipped), plus closing
the annular preventer on the smallest size drill pipe to be used within 2 minutes, and retaining a
minimum of 200 psi above the specified accumulator pre-charge pressure.

G. Locking devices, either manual (i.e., hand wheels) or automatic, will be installed on the ram type
preventers. A valve will be installed in the closing line as close as possible to the annular preventer to
act as a locking device. This valve shall be maintained in the open position and shall be closed only
when the power source for the accumulator system is inoperative.

H. Remote controls will be readily accessible to the driller and will be capable of both opening and
closing all preventers. Master controls shall be at the accumulator and shall be capable of opening and
closing all preventers and the choke line valve.

I. Well control equipment testing will be performed using clear water when the equipment is initially
installed,whenever any seal subject to test pressure is broken, following related repairs, and as a
minimum, every 30-day interval. The tests will apply to all related well control equipment.

Ram type preventers and associated equipment will be isolated and tested to 5000 psi. The annular
preventer will be tested to 2500 psi. Pressure shall be maintained for at least 10 minutes or until
requirements of test are met, whichever is longer, for all tests. A casing head valve will be open below
the test plug during testing of the BOP stack. Valves will be tested from the working pressure side with
all down-stream valves open. Kill line valves will be tested with the check valve held open or the ball
removed.

Pipe and blind rams will be activated each trip, but not more than once a day. The annular preventers
will be functionally operated at least weekly. A pit level drill will be conducted weekly for each crew.
All BOPE drills and tests will be recorded in the IADC driller's



OXY USA Inc.
Drilling Program
Federal Plateau Valley 35-1

III. Casing and Cementing:

A. Casing Program (all new casing):

Coupling Setting
Hole Size Casing Size Weight Grade Connection Diameter Depth

30" 20" Conductor 120' GL
17.50" 13.375" 68.0 J-55 BTC 14,375" 3000' KB
12.25" 9.625" 53.5 HCL-80 BTC 10.625" 8800' KB
8.50" 5.500" 20 L-80 LTC 6.050" 14000' KB

Surface Intermediate Prod Liner
Casing O. D. (in) 13.375 9.625 5.500
Casing Grade J-55 HCL-80 L-80
Weight of Pipe (lbs/ft) 68.0 53.5 20.0
Connection BTC BTC LTC

Top Setting Depth - MD (ft) 0 0 8500
Top Setting Depth - TVD (ft) 0 0 8500
Bottom Setting Depth - MD (ft) 3000 8800 14000
Bottom Setting Depth - TVD (ft) 3000 8800 14000
Maximum Mud Weight - Inside (ppg) 9.2 10.5 9.0
Maximum Mud Weight - Outside (ppg) 9.2 10.5 9.0
Design Cement Top - MD (ft) 0 2700 10750
Design Cement Top - TVD (ft) 0 2700 10700

Max. Hydrostatic Inside w/ Dry Outside (psi) 1435 4805 6552
Casing Burst Rating (psi) 3450 7390 9190
Burst Safety Factor (1.10 Minimum) 2.40 1.54 1.40

Max. Hydrostatic Outside w/ Dry Inside (psi) 1435 4805 6552
Collapse Rating 1950 8850 8830
Collapse Safety Factor (1.125 Minimum) 1.36 1.84 1.35

Casing Weight in Air (kips) 204.0 _470.8 110.0
Body Yield (kips) 1069 1244 466
Joint Strength (kips) 1140 1414 416
Tension Safety Factor (1.60 Minimum) 5.24 2.64 3.78

Casing with same or greater burst, collapse, and tension rating may be substituted for any of the
planned casing sizes depending on availability and actual
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B. Cementing Program

Casing Size Cement Slurry Quantity(sks) Density (ppg) Yield (ft'/sk)
13.375" Lead: CBM Lite 900 10.5 4.12

Tail: Premium Plus 380 15.6 1.19

9.625" Stage 2: 50:50 POZ 930 13.5 1.66
Stage 1: Premium 975 15.8 1.29

5.500" Tail: 50:50 POZ 580 13.4 l.8

Surface: 13-3/8" surface casing will be cemented from setting depth (3000' MD) to surface
and topped out with premium cement if necessary. Hardware will include a guide
shoe, float collar, top plug, and a minimum of one centralizer per joint on the
bottom four (4) casing joints, then every fourth joint to surface. Water or other
preflush fluid pumped ahead of the slurry will separate cement from the drilling
fluids.

Intermediate: 9-5/8" intermediate casing will be cemented in two stages from setting depth
(8800' MD) to 2700' (back into the surface esg shoe). Slurry volume will be based
on calipered hole size plus 10% excess. Hardware will include a guide shoe, float
collar, top plug, and a minimum of one centralizer per joint on the bottom four (4)
joints of casing and one centralizer per joint across any salt interval. Water and
preflush fluid pumped ahead of the slurry will separate cement from the drilling
fluids.

Production: 5-1/2" production casing liner will be cemented in one stage from setting depth
(14000') to 10750' (850' above the top productive zone). A minimum of 20
percent silica will be added to the cement slurry if bottom-hole temperature
exceeds 230 °F. Slurry volume will be based on calipered hole size plus 10%
excess. Hardware will include a guide shoe, float collar, top plug, and centralizers
as needed across any pay zones. Water and preflush fluid pumped ahead of the
slurry will separate cement from the drilling fluids.

Other: - The BLM will be notified at least twenty-four hours prior to running and
cementing the surface and production casing strings.
- Actual cement slurries for all casing will be based on final service company
recommendations.

- The size, weight, grade, type of thread, number of joints, and footage of all
casing run will be recorded in the driller's log. The amount and type of all cement
pumped will be recorded in the driller's log.
- Adequate time will be allowed before drilling out for the cement at the casing
shoe to achieve a minimum 500-psi compressive strength.
- Surface casing will be tested to 1000 psi before drilling out. All subsequent
casing strings will be tested to 1500 psi before drilling out and if pressure declines
by more than 10 percent in 30 minutes, corrective action will be taken.
- Before drilling more than 20 feet of new hole below each casing string, a
pressure integrity test of the casing shoe will be performed to a minimum of the
mud weight equivalent anticipated to control the pore pressure to the next casing
depth or at total depth of the
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IV. Mud Program:

Mud
Death MIELine _VALco.sity _Fhlidioss

0 - 3000' 8.6 - 9.2 Fresh Water 45 - 60 N/C to 12 cc
3000' - 8800' 9.2 - 10.5 Salt Mud 35 - 50 10 to 12 cc
8800' - 14000' 8.8 - 9.0 LSND 35 - 50 6 - 8 cc

A. After mudding up, slow pump rates will be taken daily and recorded in the driller's log.
B. Visual mud monitoring equipment will be in place to detect volume changes indicating loss or gain of

circulating fluid volume.

C. Abnormal pressures are not anticipated. In the event such pressures are to be anticipated,
electronic/mechanical mud monitoring equipment will be in place and include as a minimum; pit
volume totalizer (PVT); stroke counter; and flow sensor.

D. A 24-hour mud engineer will be onsite at all times, mud tests will be performed as needed to
determine, as applicable: density, viscosity, gel strength, filtration, and pH.

E. The 10M BOPE system is not required for conditions on this well and use of the trip tank is not
anticipated.

F. Gas detecting equipment will be installed in the mud return system, and hydrocarbon gas shall be
monitored for pore pressure changes. The presence of Hydrogen Sulfide gas is possible.

G. The need to vent combustible or noncombustible gas is not expected. If needed, a flare system
designed to gather and burn all gas will be available. The flare line discharge will be located more than
100 feet from the well head and it will be positioned downwind of the prevailing wind direction. The
flare line will have straight lines unless turns are targeted with running tees and it will be anchored.
The flare system will have an effective method for ignition.

H. Abnormal pressure is not expected. If abnormal pressure is to be anticipated, a mud-gas separator (gas
buster) will be installed and operable beginning at a point at least 500 feet above any anticipated
hydrocarbon zone of interest.

V. Evaluation:

A. Mud Log: A mud logging unit will be in operation from a depth of approximately 3000 feet to TD.
Samples will be caught, cleaned, bagged, and marked as required.

B. Drill Stem Tests: No DST's will be taken.

C. Coring: Rotary side-wall cores may be taken at select intervals in conjunction with open-hole logging
operations.

D. Wireline Logs: Wireline logs will be run as hole conditions allow from total depth to surface casing to
assist in determining lithology and potential for hydrocarbon recovery. The logging tools will at a
minimum survey resistivity, gamma radiation, and sonic velocity.

VI. Expected Bottom-Hole Pressure and Abnormal Conditions:

A. Hydrogen Sulfide: Hydrogen Sulfide (H2S) gas is possible in the deeper geologic formations to be
penetrated by this well. A H2S Drilling Operations Plan will be supplemented to this Drilling Plan.

B. Pressure: No abnormally pressured zones are expected in this well. The pressure gradient for all
potentially productive formations is expected to be approximately 0.44 psi/ft.

C. Temperature: Bottom-hole temperature at TD is expected to be approximately 318 °F.
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WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 06/30/2008 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-041-30060

WELL NAME: PLATEAU VLY FED 35-1

OPERATOR: WOLVERINE OPERATING CO ( N3035 ) PHONE NUMBER: 435-896-1943

CONTACT: PAUL SPIERING

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /

NENE 35 250S 010W Tech Review Initials Date
SURFACE: 0868 FNL 0734 FEL

BOTTOM: 0868 FNL 0734 FEL Engineering

COUNTY: SEVIER Geology
LATITUDE: 38.59713 LONGITUDE: -111.8692

UTM SURF EASTINGS:424305 NORTHINGS: 4272223 Surface

FIELD NAME: WILDCAT ( 1 )

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal

LEASE NUMBER: UTU-81364 PROPOSED FORMATION: KBAB

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal COALBED METHANE WELL? NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

/' Plat R649-2-3.

/* Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[] Unit:
(No. WY3329 )

Potash (Y/N)
R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting: 460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

/' Water Permit gy 'R649-3-3. Exception

(No. 61-2175 )
Drilling Unit

RDCC Review (Y/N)
Board Cause No:

(Date: ) Eff Date:
ÁAA Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

ADA Intent to Commingle (Y/N) R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:

STIPULATIONS: ck;
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stateRUtah'
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER
. / ExecutiveDirector

JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

Governor JOHN R. BAZA
Division Director

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

July 16, 2008

Wolverine Operating Company of Utah. LLC
1140 N Centennial Park Drive
Richfield, UT 84701

Re: Plateau Valley Federal 35-1 Well, 868' FNL, 734' FEL, NE NE, Sec. 35, T. 25 South,
R. 1 West, Sevier County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et seq., Utah
Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

Appropriate information has been submitted to DOGM and administrative approval of
the requested exception location is hereby granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous
operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date. The API
identification number assigned to this well is 43-041-30060.

Sincerely,

Gil Hunt
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Sevier County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Utah State Office

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 •facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • www.ogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS &



O O
Operator: Wolverine Operating Company of Utah. LLC
Well Name & Number Plateau Valley Federal 35-1

API Number: 43-041-30060
Lease: UTU-81364

Location: NE NE Sec._35_ T. 25 South R. 1 West

Conditions of Approval
1. General

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the division within 24 hours of spudding the well.

• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dustin Doucet at (801) 538-5281 (801) 733-0983 home

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Board").
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the



WOLVERINE OPERATING COMPANY OF UTAH, LLC
Energy Exploration in Partnership with the Environment

\WOLVERINE

July 21, 2008

Mr. Gil Hunt
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Re: API #43-041-30060 - Wolverine Operating Company of Utah, LLC
Plateau Valley Federal 35-1
NE/4 NE/4, Section 35, T25S, R1W, SLB&M
Sevier County, Utah

Dear Mr. Hunt:

Wolverine Operating Company of Utah, LLC (Wolverine) hereby submits a copy of the H2S
Contingency Plan, per Onshore Order 6, as a part of the APD for the referenced well.

Please accept this letter as Wolverine's written request for confidential treatment of all
information contained in and relating to the application and proposed well.

Thank you for consideration of these materials. Please feel free to contact me or Paul Spiering
of this office if you have any questions or need additional information.

Sincerely,

Charlie Irons
Senior Landman

RECEIVED
JUL22 2008

DIVOFOIL,GAS&MNNG

Wolverine Operating Company of Utah, LLC
1140 N Centennial Park Drive. Richfield, Utah 84701. Phone: 435-896-1943, Fax:
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H2S CONTINGENCY PLAN

Oxy USA Operations
2754 Compass Dr. Suite 170
Grand Junction CO. 81506

970-263-3600

CONTINGENCY PLAN
FOR

DRILLING, WORKOVER & COMPLETION OPERATIONS

Plateau Valley Federal 35-1

Location:
Sevier County, Utah

Section 35
Township 25 South

Range 1 West

Drilling Rig:
Nabors Rig 797

July 16, 2008
This plan is subject to updating

H2S CONTINGENCY
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H2S CONTINGENCY PLAN

I. INTRODUCTION

This plan specifies precautionary measures, safety equipment, emergency procedures,
responsibilities, and duties pertaining to drilling operations.

This plan was developed because of the potential hazards involved when drilling
formations that may contain hydrogen sulfide (H2S). It was written in compliance with
state regulations and in accordance with the recommendations of the American Petroleum
Institute publication API-RP49 "Recommended Practices for Safe Drilling of wells
containing Hydrogen Sulfide".

To be effective, this plan requires the cooperation and effort of each individual
participating in the drilling of a potential H2S well. Each individual should know his
responsibilities and duties in regard to normal drilling operations and emergency
procedures. He should thoroughly understand and be able to use, at a moment's notice,
all safety equipment on the location.. He should familiarize himself with the location of
all safety equipment and see that his equipment is properly stored, easily accessible, and
routinely maintained.

The ideas and suggestions of each individual involved in the drilling of a potential sour
gas well are highly welcomed and is an asset for providing the safest working conditions



II. LOCATION LAYOUT

A. Safe Briefing Areas

Two areas will be designated as "SAFE BRIEFING AREAS". These areas will
be located, in as much as feasible, at 180 degrees to one another on opposite sides
of the location. The Briefing Area which is predominately upwind of the
wellbore will be designated as "BRIEFING AREA NO. 1" or the "PRIMARY
BRIEFING AREA". If H2S is detected in concentrations equal to or in excess of
10ppm all personnel not assigned emergency duties are to assemble in the
designated Safe Briefing area for instructions. These areas will be located a
minimum of 200' from the wellhead.

B. Wind Indicators

Wind socks and/or streamers will be installed at strategic points on the facility.
They will be positioned so they can be seen from any location on the mud pits and
rig floor. These wind indicators will be situated so as to be illuminated during
hours of darkness. These wind indicators will be situated at separate elevations.

C. Danger Signs

A warning sign indicating the possible well conditions will be displayed at the
location entrance as well as along all routes leading to the locations

Colored flags will be displayed indicating which of the well conditions indicated
on the warning sign is applicable at the time. The green flag will be displayed
under normal operating conditions, when H2S Concentrations are less than 10
ppm. The yellow flag will be displayed when H2S concentration is present at 10
ppm or greater. The red flag will be displayed at 20 ppm or greater of H2S in the
atmosphere.

D. Office Trailers and Accommodations

All office trailers and accommodation buildings on site will be located to allow
reasonably safe distances from both the well and the outlet of the flare line.



E. Emergency Communications

Emergency communications equipment will be made available at the safe briefing
area. This equipment may be telephone, radio, mobile phone, or other
communication device that allows two-way communication should the need arise.

F. H2S Detectors and Alarms

Continuous monitoring type H2S detectors, capable of sensing a minimum of
5ppm H2Sin air, will be located at each of the followingpoints:

Sensor Locations

1) Bell nipple
2) Shale shaker
3) Drilling fluid pit area
4) Driller's station
5) Additional critical areas will be covered should they be identified.

Automatic H2S alarms (visual and audible) will be located at appropriate locations
throughout the location.

G. Breathing Air System

A system of breathing air manifolds, hoses and masks will be installed at the
wellsite with outlets at heavy work areas and the Briefing Areas.

A system of breathing air cylinders shall be tied into the manifolding system to
maintain a sufficient supply of respirable air to these areas.

A cascade-type system of air cylinders shall be available at both Briefing Areas to
facilitate the recharging of individual self-contained breathing apparatus
cylinders. All breathing air cylinders shall be labeled as containing breathing
quality air.

H. List of Safety Equipment

The location and quantity of all safety equipment (including breathing air
equipment, and H2S and SO2 detection equipment) can be found in Appendix A-2.



I. Ventilation Devices

Electric fans (with explosion-proof motors) will be installed as necessary in areas
where the potential for H2S gas accumulation exists.
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III. NORMAL OPERATING PROCEDURES

A. Prior to Compliance Depth

This H2S Contingency Plan will be operational prior to spud in of the well.

1. Lists of emergency phone numbers will be posted at the following locations:

A. Oxy Drillsite Manager office
B. Toolpusher's office
C. The safe briefing area.

2. All safety equipment must be inspected routinely, paying particular attention to
breathing air equipment and monitoring equipment.

3. All personnel onsite will be assigned breathing air equipment and, personal
monitors for H2S, capable of detecting 10ppm with audible and visual alarms.

4. Prior to compliance depth, Rig Contractor's personnel, Oxy personnel, and
necessary Service Company personnel must be thoroughly trained in the use of
breathing air equipment, emergency procedures, responsibilities and first-aid for
H2S victims. A record must be maintained of all personnel who have been
through the H2S training programs on location.

B. Below Compliance Depth

Below compliance depth the H2S detection system will be calibrated every week
under normal conditions. The time and results of each test must be logged. The
SECORP Representative will insure that the H2S detection equipment calibrations
and tests are recorded on the IADC Daily Drilling Report Form.

1. When arriving on location, all personnel, without exception, must proceed
directly to the H2S Safety Technician for assignment of breathing air
equipment and, if needed, H2S detector. An instruction and orientation
briefing will also be held, if needed. The H2S Safety Technician will be
responsible for assigning such equipment to the individuals and instructing
them in its use.

2. Each person on the location will be instructed in the use of breathing air
equipment until supervisory personnel are satisfied that each is capable of
using the equipment. This training must include all additional personnel
that are allowed onsite during drilling or testing operations.



3. Weekly breathing air equipment drills and H2S training of attendants
should be held. Documentation of these drills and training sessions shall
be maintained on location.

4. Rig crews and Service Company personnel should be made aware of the
location of breathing air bottles and H2S detectors. Knowledge of the
location of H2S detector sensors is vital to understanding the "Emergency
Conditions". In addition, key personnel must be trained in the use of the
resuscitator and H2S detectors.

5. H2S detectors shall be available for use by all working personnel. After
any device has initially detected H2S,periodic inspections of all areas of
poor ventilation shall be made with a portable H2S detector instrument.

6. All personnel on the location should become "wind-conscious" and be
aware at all times of the direction of the prevailing winds. They should
remember that H2S is heavier than air and will collect in low places in still
air.

7. There will be no welding if H2S is detected at the surface until the
surrounding air is thoroughly tested with an explosimeter and hot work
permit approved by the Oxy Drillsite Manager.

8. After penetration of an H2S bearing zone, increased monitoring of the
working area should be provided when drilling, circulating bottoms up
from a drilling break, cementing or logging. If the H2S concentration
reaches 20 ppm in the air, all personnel will wear breathing air equipment,
and all personnel not assigned emergency duties should go to the
designated Safe Briefing Area.



IV. OPERATING CONDITIONS

A. Condition I - Possible Danger - H2SPresent at Less Than 10 ppm

1. Warning Signs: A green flag will remain displayed at the well
entrance

2. Alarm: (For notification of rig crew) None

3. Characterized by: H2S concentration is less than 10 ppm.

4. General Action:

a. Be alert for a condition change. There will be no smoking except in
designated areas.

b. Check safety equipment for proper functioning. Keep it available.
No welding or open fire without hot work permit approved by
Operator's Oxy Drillsite Manager.

c. Perform all drills for familiarization and proficiency.

B. Condition II - Moderate Danger - H2S Present at 10ppm or Greater

1. Warning Sign: A yellow flag shall replace the green flag at the
wellsite entrance.

2. Alarm: Continuous flashing amber and red lights when the
concentration exceeds 10 ppm and continuous
sounding of the H2S siren when concentration
exceeds 20 ppm. All alarm signals will continue as
long as the H2S concentration is present at greater
than 10ppm or until deactivated by the H2S Safety
Technician or Oxy Drillsite Manager.

3. Characterized by: H2S concentration is equal to or greater than 10ppm.



4. General Action:

a. All personnel not specifically assigned to correct or control the
situation will report to the upwind briefing area. The number of
essential personnel may be modified at the time of operation due to
prevailing circumstances as determined by the Oxy Drillsite
Manager.

b. If the alarm sounds and it has not been preceded by Condition I, the
actions of Condition II will be taken. Circulation will be stopped,
self-contained breathing apparatus and airline work units will be
donned by all working personnel and all non-essential personnel
shall proceed to the upwind safe briefing areas.

C. Condition III - Extreme Danger - H2S Present at 20ppm or greater

1. Warning Sign: A red flag shall replace the yellow flag at the wellsite
entrance.

2. Alarm: Same as Condition II

3. Characterized by: H2S concentration is equal to or greater than 20 ppm.

4. General Action:

a. All non-essential personnel will be evacuated in an orderly manner,
immediate notification shall be given to local civil authorities, and
traffic in the immediate vicinity of the facility shall be diverted.
The State Oil and Gas Board and other appropriate governmental
agencies shall be notified.

b. The Oxy Drillsite Manager and the Contractor's Drilling Foreman
will determine which personnel are to remain onsite.

c. If necessary, all personnel will be evacuated.

d. The Contractor's Drilling Foreman and the Oxy Drillsite Manager
will jointly determine if ignition of the well is warranted. If the
well is ignited, the burning hydrogen sulfide will be converted to
sulfur dioxide (SO2), which is also highly toxic. Remain on the
upwind side of the location.



V. EMERGENCY PROCEDURES FOR H2S RELEASES:

1. The person detecting the H2S must IMMEDIATELY notify the driller.

2. The driller will pick up off bottom until first tool joint is above rotary table and
shut down the mud pumps.

3. All working rig personnel will immediately put on their breathing air equipment.

4. Once breathing air equipment is on, the driller should:

a. Begin working drill pipe.
b. Check well for flow and be ready to close the BOP's.

5. Nabor's Toolpusher will see to the shut down of the forced air circulation system.

6. All personnel must get their assigned self-contained breathing air equipment and
report to the designated safe briefing area for further instructions, unless
otherwise instructed. If both your assigned self-contained breathing apparatus
and the designated safe briefing area are upwind of the wellbore, the self-
contained breathing apparatus may be carried to the designated safe briefing area.
However, if there is any doubt, don and activate the unit immediately. If it
becomes necessary to go through the rig floor or wellhead area to get to the
designated safe briefing area, the breathing air equipment will be put on as soon
as the equipment is reached. If you are located on the downwind end of the rig
when the H2S alarm is sounded, hold your breath and proceed across then upwind
to the designated Safe Briefing Area, donning the nearest breathing air equipment
available.

7. Always put on a breathing air unit before proceeding to assist anyone affected by
the gas and utilize the "Buddy System". If the affected person is stricken in a
high concentration area obtain standby assistance before entering the area.
Always use the "Buddy System" when entering possible contaminated areas.

8. Evacuate non-essential personnel when H2S reaches a concentration exceeding
20ppm in the air.

9. The Oxy Drillsite Manager and the Contractor's Representative will assess the
situation and assign duties to each person needed to bring the situation under
control. When the severity of the situation has been determined, all persons will
be advised.



10. The Oxy Drillsite Manager will be responsible for notifying the following
regulatory agencies:

a. State Regulatory Agency
b. Filling out H2S Government Notification Log



VI. SPECIAL OPERATIONS

A. Coring

1. During drilling operations below compliance, it may be decided to core.
This operation takes on critical complexities when attempted in a sour gas
well. The following practices should be followed during coring operations:

a. After a core has been cut, circulate bottoms up and monitor mud for
H2S prior to pulling out of the hole with the core.

b. Put on breathing air equipment ten stands before core barrel reaches
the surface. If well conditions dictate, or the H2S concentration
reaches 20 ppm, breathing air equipment should be put on sooner.
All personnel in the area should wear breathing air equipment while
the core barrel is pulled, broken out, and opened. Colorimetric tube
type detectors should be used to monitor for H2S around the core
barrel. When these detectors indicate a safe atmosphere, the
breathing air equipment may be removed.

2. The followîng practices must be followed for every core barrel pulled:

a. Due to the difficulty in communicating with breathing equipment
on, it is required that a chalkboard and chalk, or note pads, be
available during core handling operations.

b. The importance of leaving the breathing air equipment on must be
stressed to all personnel connected with the coring operation. The
most critical moment is when the core barrel is opened.

c. All personnel on location not wearing breathing air equipment
should stay a safe distance upwind from the core barrel.

d. If the core contains H2S, the cores to be transported must be sealed
and marked for the presence of H2S.

e. The cores must not be transported in a closed vehicle.



B. Well Testing

1. Well testing must be performed with the minimum number of personnel
and all necessary equipment required to safely and adequately perform the
test.

2. Prior to initiation of the test, special safety meetings must be conducted
for all personnel who will participate with particular emphasis on use of
personnel safety equipment, first-aid procedures, and the I-I2SContingency
Plan.

3. During the test, the use of H2S detection equipment will be intensified.
All produced gases must be vented and burned through a flare system.
Produced fluids, which are stored in the tanks on the location, must be
vented into the flare system. Vents will have spark arrestors to prevent
any possibility of a flash back. This system will vent a minimum of 150'
from the wellhead and will be positioned as far from the working areas as
feasible taking into consideration a manner to compensate for wind
changes.

4. "No Smoking" rules will be rigorously enforced.



VII. WELL CONTROL

The following well control practices should be initiated below protective casing:

A. If high trip gas or high drill gas concentration are encountered, the degasser
should be used and the gas separated and flared. The vent line from the degasser
will be opened so that gas can be burned at the flare.

If gas is breaking out at the rotary, consider closing the annular BOP and routing
the flow through the mud-gas separator. Gas will be burned through the flare vent
line.

B. Assume any influx of formation fluid into the wellbore contains H2S. If the
decision is made to circulate out the influx, all personnel involved will wear
breathing air equipment until it is known that H2S is not present. The following
steps should be taken when the influx occurs:

1. Shut in the well using normal techniques. Record drill pipe pressure,
casing pressure, and volume of influx.

2. Notify the Oxy Drillsite Manager and the Nabor's Toolpusher.

If the mud has been contaminated with H2S, it may be necessary to treat it with
zinc carbonate (or equivalent) to treat out the H2S. If H2S is known to be present
and an influx occurs, the size of the influx, the casing depth, the leak-off test
results, the amount and type of open hole, and weather conditions will enter into
the management decision of whether to circulate out the influx or to "pump away"
the influx back into the formation.



VIII. IGNITING THE WELL

A. Responsibilities for Decision

The Oxy Drillsite Manager in consultation with the Nabor's Toolpusher would
evaluate deliberate ignition of the blowout if there is serious, immediate danger to
personnel. In such an event, the Oxy Drillsite Manager will have the ultimate
onsite responsibility while relying on the Nabor's Toolpusher for all input
regarding personnel safety. The well will be ignited only after evaluation of the
alternatives available and after discussion with the proper government agencies.

In all cases, an attempt should be made to notify the Oxv's Drilling
Superintendent and the Nabor's Manager of Drilling Operations as soon as
possible and prior to igniting the well, if possible.

If the well is ignited, the burning H2S will be converted to sulfur dioxide (SO2)
which is also highly toxic and heavier than air. Do not assume the area is safe
after the well is ignited.

B. Method of Ignition

1. The primary method of igniting the well will be with a 25mm flare gun,
which has a range of approximately 500 feet. Always ignite the well from
upwind and do not approach the well any closer than is necessary.
BEFORE firing the flare gun or igniting flammable material, check the
atmosphere at your location for combustible gases with an explosimeter.

2. If the above method of ignition fails or well conditions are such that a
safer or better method is apparent, then an alternative method should be
used.



IX. RESPONSIBILITIES AND DUTIES

A. All Personnel

1. It is the responsibility of all personnel on the drilling location, as well as
other personnel utilized to assist in drilling the well to become familiar
with the "Hydrogen Sulfide Contingency Plan".

2. Each individual may be assigned his own personnel breathing apparatus
and is responsible for assuring that the equipment is properly stored,
routinely maintained,and easily accessible.

3. Each person must become familiar with the location of all safety and
emergency equipment and SAFE BRIEFING AREAS and must be able to
use this equipment at a moment's notice.

4. Report any indications of H2S to those in the area and to the Oxy Drillsite
Manager and Nabor's Toolpusher.

5. At alarm, go to the designated SAFE BRIEFING AREA. This includes all
OFF DUTY and ON DUTY personnel not specifically designated to
control the well.

6. All personnel will attend to their personal safety _fig.

7. Help anyone who may be injured or overcome by toxic gases.

B. Oxy Drillsite Manager

1. Responsible for thoroughly understanding and enforcing all aspects of this
"H2S Contingency Plan".

2. Responsible for ascertaining that the Drilling Contractor, through Nabor's
Toolpusher, is in compliance with and is enforcing all aspects of the
"Hydrogen Sulfide Contingency Plan" for drilling where H2S may be
encountered.

3. Responsible for insuring that all other Oxy and third party personnel
comply with the "Hydrogen Sulfide Contingency Plan".

4. Responsible for restricting third party personnel and visitors to the site to a
minimum, especially during expected hazardous operations.



5. Responsible for notifying all of the personnel of a change in conditions.
Oxy Drillsite Manager will notify regulatory agencies as required when
either Condition II or Condition III exists.

6. In conjunction with the Nabor's Toolpusher will initiate the evacuation
plan.

7. In conjunction with the Nabor's Toolpusher is responsible for assuring
that personnel training is conducted.

8. Responsible for assuring that all H2S detectors are inspected and
functional.

9. Responsible in conjunction with Nabor's Toolpusher for displaying the
visible warning system signs and proper flags, as appropriate.

10. Responsible, along with the Nabor's Toolpusher for assuring that all
hydrogen sulfide safety programs and training sessions are conducted and
those records of attendance are maintained, and kept onsite.



C. Nabor's Toolpusher

1. In conjunction with the Oxy Drillsite Manager, is responsible for seeing
that all personnel on location observe all safety and emergency procedures
outlined in this "H2S Contingency Plan".

2. Shares the responsibility of the Oxy Drillsite Manager for assuring that
training is conducted for all personnel onsite.

3. Responsible for thoroughly understanding the contents of this "H2S
Contingency Plan". In the absence or incapacitation of the Oxy Drillsite
Manager, the Nabor's Toolpusher will assume all responsibilities
designated herein to the Oxy Drillsite Manager.

4. Along with the Oxy Drillsite Manager, is responsible for assuring that all
hydrogen sulfide safety programs and training sessions are conducted and
that records of attendance are maintained, and kept onsite.

5. Will check the ventilation needed to keep any H2S from accumulating in
living quarters or unexpected places.

6. Responsible, in conjunction with the Oxy Drillsite Manager, for
displaying the visible warning system signs and flags as appropriate.

7. Will be in charge of SAFE BRIEFING AREA during assembly for
evacuation.



D. Mud Engineer

1. In addition to the normal duties, the Mud Engineer is responsible for
insuring that the drilling rig has a sufficient supply of hydrogen sulfide
scavenger available at all times.

2. Must be thoroughly familiar with the procedures for treating hydrogen
sulfide-contaminated mud.

E. H2S Safety Technician

1. Responsible for performing a weekly inventory to assure that all safety
equipment is being properly stored and maintained.

2. Responsible for logging the arrival and departure of all personnel on
location.

3. Responsible for H2S training, which includes the use, maintenance, and
storage of the safety equipment for all personnel upon arrival onsite.

4. Responsible for issuing H2S safety equipment to arriving personnel onsite.

5. Must maintain and repair all personnel's safety equipment.

6. Responsible for the required inspection and sanitizing of the H2S safety
equipment.

7. Must maintain H2S Safety training attendance records and other record
keeping required. All training records to be kept onsite during the job.
Will provide the Oxy Drillsite Manager a copy of all class attendance
records.

8. Will observe and assist during hydrogen sulfide drills.

9. Will observe testing of the hydrogen sulfide monitors weekly for response.



X. PROCEDURE FOR INFORMING PERSONNEL OF H2S CONTINGENCY PLAN

A. There will be copies of the complete "H2S Contingency Plan" available in the
Oxy Drillsite Manager's office.

B. All personnel arriving at the location will report immediately to the H2S Safety
Technician for f'amiliarization with the Considerations During the Drilling of a
Sour Gas Well.

C. The H2S Safety Technician will train the crews and familiarize them with the
Considerations During the Drilling of a Sour Gas Well. Written records will be
maintained at the location and off-site.



XI. EVACUATION OF PUBLIC
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B. List of Residents

There are no residencies or public dwellings within a one-mile radius of the proposed
drilling site.



XII. APPENDIX A

A-1 Considerations During the Drilling of a Sour Gas Well

This memorandum is intended to familiarize you with the conditions that can exist when
drilling a well into formationthat may contain Hydrogen Sulfide gas, and the precautions
the Operator and drilling contractor have taken in designing the well program and the
safety program to provide maximum safety.

You should become familiar with all safety equipment on the site; its use and availability.
The windsock and windstreamers are provided to show which direction the wind is
blowing so that the 'Safe Briefing Area' can be easily defined. You should become 'wind
conscious' and frequently observe these wind direction indicators. All persons on
location will receive instructions in the use of safety equipment and what to do during an
H2S emergency. The well will be monitored continuously by a solid-state, fixed
monitoring detection system.

During an emergency, all personnel shall utilize the 'buddy system', preventing anyone
from entering a potentially toxic area alone, regardless of whether or not they are using
breathing apparatus. If you are wearing a respirator, do not remove it until you are
absolutely sure the air is safe to breathe. If a sudden gas release occurs, without warning,
you should:

1) Hold your breath and rapidly evacuate the area containing the H2S. Move across
and upwind, if possible.

2) Put on breathing apparatus.
3) Help anyone who may have been overcome by the gas, only after vou have put

on your breathine apparatus, and transport him to a safe upwind area where you
can administer resuscitation.

4) Evacuate to the upwind 'Briefing Area' where further instructions can be
delivered. DO NOT PANIC!

The Company intends to keep all formations overbalanced with mud weight so that no
influx of toxic gas will occur. However, these plans have been provided so that such an
influx can be handled with a minimum of difficulty. It is important that you follow the
directives of the Oxy Drillsite Manager and the contractor's representative during any
emergency, to insure the safety of all personnel.



A-2 Riesite H,S Safety Equipment

1 Hydrogen Sulfide Safety Trailer Complete with the following contents:

8 300 cu. ft. Breathing Air Cylinders, manifold, breathing hoselines
with quick connect fittings and recharge line for primary briefing area

1 Oxygen resuscitator with two (2) spare oxygen cylinders
1 Sensidyne gas detector with H2S, SO2 and CO2 tubes
8 Del Mar H2S spot check detectors
1 Portable Trimeter for H2S, LEL and Oxygen Readings
3 Flag pole and assembly with three (3) warning flags
3 Wind sock holders with three (3) windsocks
1 First Aid Kit and Eye Wash Station
1 Bull Horn
2 Safety harness with safety line
1 25 MM flare pistol and 12 flare shells
2 Dry chemical fire extinguishers
15 Sets of ear plugs
1 Packet "NO SMOKING" signs
2 Fire Blankets
1 Wire stretcher
2 Cleaning sanitizers
3 Well condition entrance sign with instructions
2 Briefing Area Signs
35 30-Minute air masks with case, lightweight cylinder (2216 psi) and stainless steel

quick-connectfor cascade/hose line use. All units are pressure-demand and hold
NIOSH approval.

6 5-Minute airline masks with emergency escape cylinders & watertight storage
boxes.

2 Cascade Units each with (6) 300 Cu. Ft. breathing air cylinders for rig use
1 Breathing Air Compressor
78 Manifold connections for Primary and Secondary Briefing Areas and rig use.
2 100' Breathing air hoe lines with quick connect
10 50' Breathing Air hose lines with quick connect
5 25' Breathing air hoe lines with quick connect
60 Pigtails Breathing Air hose lines with quick connect for Briefing Areas
1 4-Channel Hydrogen Sulfide Detection System with (4) sensors
3 Explosion Proof Alarms complete with (2) lights and (1) siren



A-3 Personnel Training

All personnel will be informed of the hazards of hydrogen sulfide and sulfur dioxide and
instructed in the provisions for personnel safety contained in the H2S Contingency Plan.
All personnel will be instructed in the use of any safety equipment, which they may be
required to use. They will also be informed of the location of protective breathing
apparatus, H2S detectors and alarms, ventilation equipment, briefing areas, warning
systems, evacuation procedures and the prevailing winds. In addition, personnel will be
informed of the restrîctions and corrective measures concerning beards, spectacles and
contact lenses in accordance with OSHA Standard 29CFR 1910.134 and ANSI Z88.2.
First aid procedures applicable to victims of H2S exposure will be included in the training
program.

Instruction of personnel shall be initiated as soon as possible following their arrival on
the location.

An H2S drill and training session will be held for all personnel on location. FULL
PARTICIPATION is mandatory. All H2S drills shall be entered into the IADC Drilling
Log.

*Reicords of all drills and/or training sessions shall be maintained at the facility.

A copy of the training handout, which will be given to each individual trained on site, is
included in this Appendix; also included is the guideline for the H2S drills.

This training will be conducted to instruct personnel in the operation and use of self-
contained breathing apparatus and H2S related emergency equipment and to review
various operating procedures in the "H2S CONTINGENCY PLAN".

Initial drills should include:

1. General information about the self-contained breathing apparatus supply time
limit, and proper packing and storage.

2. How to put the mask on and test for leaks around the face and hose connections.



These drills will be conducted as often as necessary to acquaint the crews with the
equipment. After the Oxy Drillsite Manager and the Nabor's Toolpusher are convinced
that all personnel are trained, a drill should be conducted. This drill may be initiated any
time. The drill will be initiated by the H2S audible alarm signal given by the Contractor's
Representative or the Oxy Drillsite Manager. At this time, all off-duty personnel will
immediately get their assigned self-contained breathing apparatus and report to the
designated SAFE BRIEFING AREA with their emergency equipment within three
minutes after the alarm is sounded.

A training and information session will be conducted after each drill to answer any H2S
related questions and to cover one or more of the following:

1. Condition II and III alerts and steps to be taken by all personnel.

2. The importance of wind direction when dealing with H2S.

3. Proper use and storage of all types of breathing equipment.

4. Proper use and storage of oxygen resuscitation.

5. Proper use and storage of H2S detectors and colormetric tube-type detectors.

6. The "Buddy System" and the rescue procedure for a person overcome by H2S.

7. Responsibilities and duties.

8. Location of H2S safety equipment.

9. Other parts of the "H2S CONTINGENCY PLAN" that should be reviewed.

NOTE: A record of attendance must be kept for drills and training sessions. These drills
and training sessions must also be documented on the IADC Report.



A-4 Emergenev Telephone Notification List

TITLE NAME PHONE

Oxy Drilling Superintendent Tom Zupan (C) 970-985-0260

Oxy HES Coordinator Alonzo Hernandez (C) 970-985-6055

Oxy Drilling Engineer Rusty Hanna (C) 970-985-6055

Nabors District Manager Terry Boyd (C) 307-797-2223

SAFETY COMPANY NAME PHONE

Secorp Industries (24 Hours) (800) 327-5026
2101 Jefferson Street (337) 237-3471
Lafayette, La. 70560 (F) (337) 235-6278

District Manager Kyle Sauls (O) (337) 237-1972
(C) (337) 499-9651



Emergency Phone Numbers

LAW ENFORCEMENT AGENCIES:

Sheriffs Office
250 N Main St
Richfield, UT 84701
15.82 miles from Sevier, UT 84754
(435) 896-2600
Emergency - 911

Police Department
75 E Center St
Richfield, UT 84701
15.67 miles from Sevier, UT 84754
(435) 896-8484
Emergency -911

Fire Dept
Richfield Interagency Fire Center
(435) 896-6346

Utah Oil & Gas Commission
Major Undesirable Events
Office hours: 801-538-5340
After hours: 801-243-9466

Minor Events
Office hours: 801-538-5340



MEDICAL FACILITIES AND PERSONNEL:

Ambulance
Sevier County Dispatch (435) 896-6471

Medical Helicopter
Sevier County Dispatch (435) 896-6471

Hospital
Sevier Valley Medical Center
1000 N Main St
Richfield, UT 84701
(435) 893-4100

OTHER EMERGENCY CONTACT:

Poison Control Center 800-292-6678



A-5 Government Agenev Notification Log

NOTIFICATION OF GOVERNMENT AGENCIES IN THE EVENT OF A
RELEASE OF FíYDROGEN SULFIDE GAS

DATE:

Operating Company:

Oxy Drillsite Manager:

Drilling Contractor/Rig:

Tool Pusher:

Location:

REPORT DATE AND TIME:

ESTIMATED PPM RELEASE:

NOTIFICATIONOF GOVERNMENT AGENCIES:

Contact Made By: Individual Contacted Time

STATE AGENCY: (phone)

Comments:



XIII. APPENDIX B

B-1 Properties of Hydrogen Sulfide

. Hydrogen sulfide is a highly toxic, colorless gas with the chemical formula H2S. It is
about 20% more dense than air. It can readily be dispersed by air movement.

• It is weakly soluble in water to produce a slightly acidic solution and is strongly
absorbed by alkaline solutions to form metal sulfides.

• Hydrogen sulfide forms flammable mixtures with air. The minimum auto-ignition
temperature (260°C-500F occurs at concentrations of about 15%). At higher
concentrations it burns mainly to water and sulfur and at lower concentrations to
water and sulfur dioxide and combustion occurs with a pale blue flame.

. Hydrogen sulfide is highly corrosive to certain metals. In particular materials
containing copper should never be utilized.

• Metal sulfides are all combustible. In some cases spontaneous ignition at room
temperature is possible.

. Hydrogen sulfide is easily identified by its characteristic smell of rotten eggs at low
concentrations 1-30 ppm. A noticeable odor will exist at very low concentrations
(0.01ppm).At higher concentrations it becomes sweetish and at about 150 ppm
olfactory paralysis occurs when the sense of smell cannot be relied on at all.



B-2 Physiology and Long Term Effects

• As stated previously, H2S is extremely toxic at relatively low concentrations. Table 1
lists the various effects at different levels of exposure.

• At very low concentrations, in normal circumstances, it is absorbed through the lungs
into the blood stream forming non-toxic compounds. As the level of the free radical
increases it poisons the nervous system producing eventual paralysis of the
respiratory centre in the brain causing respiratory failure and death.

• In addition, H2S has a profoundly irritant effect on the eyes due to the formation of
weak sulfurous acid. Acute damage may be severe with blurring of vision and the
formation of blisters. Recovery is usually complete, scarring is very rare and there are
no cumulative effects.

• At high concentrations the sense of smell is rapidly lost, and death by respiratory
paralysis is rapid if exposure continues.

• Recent medical research now indicates that perforated eardrums do not pose any
significant risk as a route for absorption of H2S.

• Alcohol in the blood stream enhances the effect of H2S poisoning.

• Delayed irritant effects on the lungs may present acute chemical pneumonia
inflammation up to 24 hours after acute exposure and should be treated as for
Pulmonary Edema, by a Medical Practitioner.

• In cases where the victim has been successfully revived, there may be permanent
nervous, brain or behavioral damage due to the lack of oxygen supply to the brain
during the acute poisoning phase.



TABLE 1

PHYSIOLOGICAL RESPONSES TO CONCENTRATIONS OF H2S
H2S Concentration in air Response Classification

(ppm)

101 Can smell 1. Permissible Exposure Limit (PEL) -

Minimal effect over 8_hours 8 hour continuous exposure

101 Minimal eye irritation Irritation

irritation Irritation

70 - 150 Kills smell in 3 - 15 minutes, 100 ppm presents Immediate
irritates eyes, throat and lungs Danger to Life and Health.

Concentration that may cause death

150 - 400 Loss of smell Dangerous
Dizziness
Difficult respiration
Coughing
Irritation of eyes, throat and lungs
Needs prompt removal to fresh air
if respiratory paralysis is to be
avoided

400 - 700 Coughing Dangerous
Collapse May produce severe injury or death
Unconsciousness
Death
Breathing will stop and death will
result if not given artificial
resuscitation immediately

produces unconsciousness ÏÑÊ$5aieiÑ$$iá ÏÏÑ
ermanent þraindamage possibg

Above 1000ppm immediate unconsciousness, death
in a few minutes

Notes :

1. above values in ppm refer to concentrations "in air" and not "in stream".
2. Above values are approximate as susceptibility varies significantly between individuals
exposed



B-3 Drilling Fluids and H2S Control

The drilling fluid is the primary means of preventing a release of H2S. It achieves this by:

1) Maintaining sufficient hydrostatic head to prevent H2S influx from the formation in
the wellbore.

2) Keeping H2S in the mud by converting it to sodium sulfide, provided that the pH is
over 10.

3) Removing dissolved H2S and/or sodium sulfide with a scavenger such as Zine
Carbonate or Ironite sponge.

B-4 Controlling Principles

pH Control

In water based mud systems the dissolved H2S reacts with the caustic to form soluble
sulfide. The effect is more pronounced at higher pH. However, if the pH falls below 10,
the dissolved sodium sulfide will convert back to H2S at surface and will come out of
solution as a free gas.

Scavengers

At low pH (less than 10) there is equilibrium at surface between H2S dissolved in mud
and H2S gas bubbling out. At a pH greater than 10.5 the H2S is converted by caustic to
sodium sulfide and there is no H2S in solution to come out at surface. If the pH is greater
than 11.5 and the sulfide levels are increasing then H2S must be entering downhole. The
mud weight should be increased to prevent this and the sulfides should be treated out by
adding an H2S scavenger e.g. Zinc Carbonate or Ironite Sponge. These form insoluble
Zine Sulfides which will not be converted back to H2S even if the pH drops.

Zinc Carbonate is the most commonly available scavenger. Approximately 0.5 lb/bbl is
sufficient to treat 200 ppm H2S or sulfide ions in the mud.

Large additions of zinc carbonate will adversely affect mud properties. This can be
reduced by strict control of drilled solids and by adding thinners and KOH to the mud.
These should be added as a premix to maintain the pH above 11.5.



B-5 Monitoring of H2S Drilling Fluids

There are various methods available to monitor the level of H2S contamination in drilling
mud. The majority requires the use of mud laboratory test facilities and is not continuous
in nature.

None of these methods will positively identify the presence of I-I2Sin the formations, but
if the mud is close to balance, and seeps into the mud, they should detect it.

B-6 Stocking of Materials

A minimum stock of Zinc Carbonateto the treat the entire active system with 0.5 lbs per
bbls or one (1) pallet which ever is greater should at the rig site at all times.



XIV. APPENDIX C

C-1 Effects of H2S on Drilling Equipment

Sulfide Stress Cracking (SCC)

Sulfide Stress Cracking, also known as hydrogen blistering, hydrogen enbrittlement and
stress cracking, is due to reaction of iron in a moist H2S environment.

H2S + Fe + H2O--> FeS (Iron Sulfide) + 2H (free Hydrogen + H2O)

o Most of the hydrogen produced is released but, with pressure, some is absorbed into
the metal. It migrates along the grain boundaries and recombines to form molecular
hydrogen which occupies a larger volume than the hydrogen atoms.

o The hydrogen molecules cause increased internal stresses leading to blistering or
embrittlement. This occurs particularly if there are any inclusions in the steel.

o Hydrogen embrittlement occurs in materials with yield strengths of over 90,000 psi.
It is a true intergranular failure of the material. It is a delayed failure, since time is
required for the hydrogento diffuse in the metal to points of high stress.

Factors Affecting Failure

Failure of materials is affected by the following factors:

- H2S concentration
- Total and partial pressure applied
- Metal chemical composition, strength, heat treatment and

microstructure
- Total tensile stress
- Temperature
- Time
- Solution pH

Standards applying to metals for H2S Situations

The most commonly applied standard for metals in a H2S environment is the NACE
Standard MR-01-B (latest edition). This is generally accepted as the Standard for all
oilfield equipment.



C-2 Metals for Use in H,S Enviromnent

• The major selection criterion for any metal that is to be used in an H2S environment is
the surface hardness. The relationship of SSC and surface hardness is well
documentedand it is evident that metals of less than 22 Rockwell "C" Hardness Scale
are not susceptible to Sulfide Stress Corrosion (SSC).

• The second selection factor is the ultimate yield strength. This should be less than
95,000 psi.

• Metals within this range will not fail due to SSC throughout the full temperature
range. However, there is evidence that stronger materials can be used above 160°F

-

see Tables 2 and 3.
• It is worth examining the various common components used in drilling in H2S

environments and how they vary from standard items.
• API recommends that all steel drill pipe used has a yield strength of less than 95,000

psi. Any failure is likely to occur near the surface, where the pipe is under maximum
stress and does not have the protection of elevated temperatures. This restriction
affects string design on deep wells.

• If aluminum drill pipe is used, pH must be limited to 10.5 avoid accelerated weight
loss corrosion.

• Tubular goods must be made up correctly to prevent stress concentrations which can
cause SSC.

Drill Collars

These are largely unaffected by H2S because of the lower stress involved and the high
operating temperatures.

Annular BOPs

Hydril manufacture their annulars with material of hardness less than Rc22 to permit use
in H2S.

The selection of packing units is governed by drilling fluid type rather than H2S.
However, H2S will reduce the service life of the material.



BOPs

Both API and NACE lay down standards for BOP's in H2S service. The basic
requirement is for materials of hardness less than Rc22.

This is not always possible for the rams. For blind rams and rams, materials up to Rc26
can be used. For blind rams and shear rams, the blades must be of high strength, high
hardness material. This makes them susceptible to SSC.

Rubber goods in the BOP's need to be changed to nitrile elastomers.

Wellhead valves for H2S

These are produced generally to NACE MR-01-75 however, some companies prefer to
tailor valves to specific requirement.

Welding of Materials

On H2S equipment most connections are made by welding or welded flanges. The
important point is that after welding the Heat Affected Zone (HAZ) must be stress
relieved by tempering. The hardness of the HAZ and base metal must be less than Rc22.

The welds must be qualified to appropriate API or ASME specifications. THIS
PRECLUDES ANY FIELD WELDING.

C-3 Precautions against H2SCorrosion

An advantage in drilling is that the service environment can be controlled. Also
operations take place at high temperatures which reduces H2S attack.

Drilling Fluids
A number of methods can be used to control the effects of H2S on the drill string:

1) Use of sulfide scavengers, to chemically absorb the H2S e.g. Ironite
sponge or Zinc carbonate.

2) Keeping pH in mud between 10 and 11.5 will help to neutralize H2S.
3) Using oil based mud to form a non-conductive oil film on the steel.



Inspection of Components

• It is difficult to inspect items exposed to H2S for possible SSC, due to the inter-
granular nature of the attack.

• If blistering occurs or the SSC is associated with inclusions in the metal, it can be
detected by ultra-sonic or x-ray.

TABLE 3

Acceptable Materials for Subsurface Equipment for Direct Exposure to Sour
Environment.

USE MATERIAL
Drillable packer components Ductile Iron (ASTM A-536, A-571
Drillable packer components Malleable Iron (ASTM A-2000, A-602)
Compression members Gray Iron (ASTM A-48, A-278)
All SCR-lMo (ASTM A-199 Gr T9,

A-200 Gr T9, A-276 Gr F9)*
ASTM A-213 T9

* Maximum hardness of HRC 22
ABSTRACTFROM NACE MR-0 I-75 (1980)



STATE OF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OlL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator: OXY USA Inc Operator Account Number: N 0415

Address: 2754 Compass Drive, Ste 170

city Grand Junction

state CO zio 81506 Phone Number: (970) 263-3629

WelH

API Number Wel(Name Q See Tp Rng Cpunty
4304130060 PLATEAU VALLEY FEDERAL 35-1 NENE 35 25S 1W Sevier

Action Code Current Entity New Entitÿ Spud Dat Entity Asaignment
Nurnbe Nu über Effective Date

A 9/25/2008 ¿) þ‡
Comm n :

Well 2

API Number Well Name QQ See Twp Rng ounty

Action Code CM(r litt gntity New Entity Spud Date Erítity Assigranent
Numb r Number Effective I¾te

Comments:

Well 3

API 14umber Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng C40nty

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud hate Entity Assignment
Number Nutaber Effective Date

Comments:

ACT10N CODES:
A - Establish new entity for new well (síngle well only) Daniel L Padilla

B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unit well) Name (Please Print)

C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity signature
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) Regulatory Coordinator (À

RECEIVED
(5/2000)

SEP2 92008
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. DJJ

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 9/24/2008

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N3035-Wolverine Operating Co of UT LLC NO415-OXY USA, Inc.

55 Campau NW PO Box 27757
Grand Rapids, MI 49503-2616 Houston, TX 77227-7757

Phone: 1 (616) 458-1150 Phone: 1 (970) 263-3637

CA No. Unit:
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

I I:
NO TYPE STATUS

BURRVILLE FED 3-1 03 50S 10W 4304130059 Federal OW APD C
PLATEAU VLY FED 35-1 35 50S 10W 4304130060 Federal OW DRL C

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 9/29/2008
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 9/18/2008
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 9/29/2008
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 823198-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM not yet BIA

7. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: n/a

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: n/a

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 9/29/2008
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 9/29/2008
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: n/a
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: n/a
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: n/a
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: 9/29/2008
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ES0136
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: n/a
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number n/a

3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a
COMMENTS:

OXY USA FORM A.xis



Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES oO
B -

3D7
(August 2007) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires: July 31, 2010

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.
UTU-81364

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
Do not use this form for proposals to dri/I or to re-enter an N/A

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on page 2. 7. If Unit of CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
N/A

1. Type of Well

Oil Well Gas Well Other NËI eaydFeNd
ral 35-1

2. Name of Operator 9. API Well No.
OXY USA Inc. (OXY) 4304130060

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool or Exploratory Area
HoO.ston T7X77577227-7757

(970) 263-3637 Exploratory

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T.,R.,M, or SurveyDescription) 11. Country or Parish, State
Section 35, Township 25 South, Range 1 West, SLB&M
At surface: 868' FNL, 734' FEL, being in NE4NE4 At prod. zone: 868' FNL, 734 FEL, being in NE4NE4 Sevier, UT (041)

12. CHECK THE APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Operator change
Subsequent Report

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation: Clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof. If
the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports must be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 must be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices must be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

OXY USA Inc. (OXY) is providing notice that the operator of the Plateau Valley Federal 35-1 well has changed from Wolverine Operating Company of Utah,
LLC to OXY. OXY requests the effective date to occur on or around September 24, 2008. As part of the operator transfer, OXY has reviewed and accepts the
conditions of approval as issued on June 25, 2008 by Wayne Wetzel of the Richfield Field Office of the BLM. OXY's existing BLM/BIABond No. is ES 0136.
OXY's Utah oil and gas operator number is NO416. Also, OXY has provided the Utah Oil and Gas Commission a copy of the Notice of Intent.

APPROVED /N / OÑ

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct. Name (Printed/Typed)

Daniel I. Padilla Title Regulatory Coordinator

Signature
N-- L Date

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by

fitle Date
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or certify
that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would Office
entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false,
fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
(Instructions on page



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
UTU-81364

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 FINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITorCA AGREEMENTNAME:Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantlydeepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, ort° N/Adrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLlCATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBEROiL )NELL GAS WELL Q OTHER

Plateau Valley Federal 35-1
2 m Eeor

n Oe ating Company of Utah, LLC 3
1M3

60
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1140 N. Centennial Park Dr crrv Richfield

STATE UT z 84701 (435) 896-1943 Exploratory
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 868' FNL, 734' FEL COUNTY: Sevier

QTR/QTR,SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,MERlDIAN:NENE 35 25S 1W STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE,REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDI E DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICEOF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASINGREPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

O CHÁNGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

2 SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMtNGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SlTE OTHER:

O CONVERTWELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENTFORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

WolverineOperating Company of Utah, LLCwillnot be the operator of record for the Plateau Valley Federal 35-1. The new
operator will be OXY USA Inc.

RECEIVED
SEP2 92008

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

d Hi Manager - Developrnent

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED / / () R
CONFŒ¾TIAL

(5/2000) Division of Oil,Gasan Minmg (See instructions on Reverse Side)
Earlene Russell, Engineering



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING

Request to Transfer Application or Permit to Drill

(This form should accompany a Sundry Notice, Form 9, requesting APD transfer)

Well name: Plateau Valley Federal 35-1

API number: 4304130060

Location: Qtr-Q1r:NENE Section: 35 Township: 25 South Rânge: 1 West
Company that filed original application: Wolverine Operating Company of Utah, LLC

Date original permit was issued: 08/22/2008

Company that permit was issued to: WolverineOperating Company of Utah, LLC

Check
Desîred Action:

Transfer pending (unapproved) Application for Permit to Drill to new operator
The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property, hereby verifles that the information as
submitted in the pending Application for Perrnit to Drill, remains valid and does not require revision. The new
owner of the application accepts and agrees to the information and procedures as stated in the application.

/ Transfer approved Application for Permit to Drillto new operator
The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted, hereby verifies that the
information as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require
revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which shouíci be verified. Yes No

if located on private land, has the ownership changed?

If so, has the surface agreement been updated?

Haveany wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect the spacing or siting |requirements for this location?
Have there been any unit or other agreernents put in place that could affect the permitting or operation of this
proposed well?
Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership or right-of-way,which could affect the
proposed location?

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed?

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or accis route which will require a change in
plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation?
Is bondirig still in place, which covers this proposed well? Bond No. ES 0136

Any desired or necessary changes to either a pending or approved Application for Permit to Drillthat is being transferred,
should be filed on a Sundry Notice, Form 9, or amended Application for Permit to Drill, Form 3, as appropriate, with
necessary supporting information as required.

Name (please print) Daniel I. Padilla t¡g Regulatory Coordinator

Signature Date 2 $Z
Representing (company name) OXY USA Inc RFCFivFD
The p so igning this form must have legal authority to represent the company or Individual(s) to be listed as the new operato li or

(3/2004) DRO



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS ANDMINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-81364

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 FINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° N/Adrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL Q OTHER Plateau Valley Federal 35-1

2. NAMEOI¯0PERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

OXY USA Inc. 4304130060
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POÖL, OR WILDCAT:

2754 Compass Drive Ste 17(crrY Grand Junction . . STATE CO ZIP 1506 (970) 263-3629 Exploratory
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 868 FNL, 734' FEI, beiñg irt NENE COUNTY: $6VÍGY

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENE 35 25S TW S STATE:
UTAH

. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT,OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE ÓF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DI¯EPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Dupilcate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATÓR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

OXY USA Inc. (OXY)is providing notice to change in the original drillingplan for the Plateau ValleyFederal 35-1 well. OXY's
contractor, Lang Exploration and Drilling, proposes to drill30 feet of 40-inch structural pipe and 1100 feet of 20-inch conductor.
Both structural and conductor pipes willbe cemented to surface. 13-3/8" surface casing is still planned to be set at 3000'. This
change to the original drillingplan was due to the conventional auger rig not achieving the plans due to an unconsolidated
volcanic gravel bed below the pad. Verbal approval was received from Al McKee with the BLMon September 30, 2008
regarding the change to the original drilling plan.

AccGDied by theUtah D 100 of
S and Mining RECEIVED

FORRECORDONLY OCT09 2008
DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING

NAME(PLFASEPRINT) Daniel I. Padilla TITLE Regulatory Coordinator

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-81364

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 FINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° N/Adrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL
OIL WELL O GAS WELL OTHER P

aE AU an we
eral 35-1

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

OXY USA Inc. 4304130060
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

PO Box 27757
CITY

Houston STATE TX ZIP
77227-7757 (970) 263-3637 Exploratory

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 868' FNL, 734' FEL, being in NENE COUNTY: Sevier

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENE 35 25S 1W S STATE:
UTAH

. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Onginal Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Beqan drillinqwell
10/31/2008 O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

OXY USA Inc. is providing notice that surface conductors have been set and drilling operations began on 10/31/2008, on the
Plateau Valley Federal 35-1 well.

RECEIVED
NOV1O2008

DIV.OFOlL,GAS&MINING

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Daniel I. Padilla TITLE Regulatory Coordinator

SIGNATURE DATE 11/5/2008

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-81364

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 FINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° N/Adrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL O OTHER P

aEL n Me

eral 35-1
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

OXY USA Inc. 4304130060
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
PO Box 27757 cin Houston STATE TX ZIP

77227-7757 (970) 263-3637 Exploratory
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 868' FNL, 734' FEL, being in NENE COUNTY: Sevier

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENE 35 25S 1W S STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPA1RWELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Beqan drillinqwell
10/31/2008 O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

OXY USA Inc. is providing notice that surface conductors have been set and drillingoperations began on 10/31/2008, on the
Plateau Valley Federal 35-1 well.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Dan el Padilla TTE Regula0toryCoordinator

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU-81364

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 FINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new welîs, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to N/Adri]Ihorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1.TYPEOFWELL 8.\NELLNAMEandNUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Plateau Valley Federal 35-1

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

OXY USA Inc. 4304130060
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FlELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

PO Box 27757 crrY Houston STATE ZIP
77227-7757 (970) 263-3637 Exploratory

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 868' FNL, 734' FEL, being in NENE COUNTY: Sevier

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENE 35 25S 1W S STATE:
UTAH

. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Beqan drillinqwell
10/31/2008

CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

OXY USA Inc. is providing notice that surface conductors have been set and drillingoperations began on 10/31/2008, on the
Plateau Valley Federal 35-1 well.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT TIATE Regula0toryCoordinator

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



OXY USA

CONFIDENTIALDAILYOPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: 10/31/2008

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 36

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINALKB @7,920.00ft DFS: 0.19
Today's MD: 1,211.0 ft Progress: 111.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 1,100.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 4.50 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 /98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 24.7 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: @ Lithology:

Current Ops: DRILLINGAHEAD
24-Hr Summary: DRILLED OUT CEMENT IN THE 20" CONDUCTOR. DRILLED AHEAD @ 1211'
24-Hr Forecast: CONTINUE DRILLINGTOWARDS SURFACE TD OF 3000'

CASIÑO/WELL CONTR0L HOOKLOAD&TORQUE HYDRAULICS MUDGAS Av Max
Last Casing: 40.000in @65ft Str Wt UplDn: / Pump Rate: 787.0 Conn:
Next Casing: 9.625\n @3,000ft Str Wt Rot: Pump Press: 1,400.0 Trip:

Last BOP Press Test: 01/01/2000 Torq Off Btm: Backgr:

Form Test/EMW: Torq On Btm:

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA(LAST 6)
Supervisor 1: DUB CAMERON MD Incl Azi TVD NI-8 El-W VS DLS Ikiild
Supervisor 2:

__

1,174.0 0.12 351.99 1,174.00 1.1 -0.6 1.1 0.05 -0.05

Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 990.0 0.22 349.17 990.00 0.6 -0.5 0.6 0.17 0.16
Geologist: KIRK SPARKMAN 900.0 0.08 20.48 900.00 0.3 -0.4 0.3 0.14 -0.13
Oxy Personnel: 0 800.0 0.21 47.21 800.00 0.1 -0.6 0.1 0.16 0.12
Contractor Personnel: 21 700.0 0.09 358.94 700.00 -0.1 -0.7 -0.1 0.09 0.04
Total on Site: 21 600.0 0.05 279.81 600.00 -0.1 -0.7 -0.1 0.05 -0.02

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
1 17.500 HUGHES CHRISTE GTX-CO9 6071441 435 1x18, 3x16 1,135.0 2,782.0 2-1-WT-A E-1-WT-TQ

\
BIT OPERATING PARAMETERS TODAY

Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI
Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

1 4.50 4.50 111.E 111.0 24.7 24.7 8.0/15.0 20/60 0.838 714. 306.5 1.4

MUD DATAS NENPARK-AVA LAST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: ED MCDANIAL/DAVEOWE MBT: 12.5 lbm/bbl BHA No: #1 Bit No: 1 MD In: 1,135.0 ft
Sample From: PIT pH: 9.5 Purpose: ROTARY STEERABLE "PUSH THE BIT" MD Out: 2,782.0 ft
Mud Type: LOW SOLIDS / NON-DISP Pm / Pom: Com onent OD ID Jts Len th
Time / MD: 0:01 / 1,135.0 Pf I Mf: 0.4 / 1.0
Density @ Temp: 8.50 / 70 Chlorides: 500 TRI-CONE BIT 17.500 3.750 1 1.32

Rheology Temp: 70 Ca+ / K+: / RSS (PUSH BIT) 9.500 3.200 1 14.02
Viscosity: 60.00 CaCl2: BTRING STABILIZER 17.375 2.440 1 8.09
PV I YP: 11 / 22 Clom: VlWDTOOL 8.310 6.250 1 26.47
Gels 10s/10m/30m:8 / 13 / 15 Lime: 3AVERSUB 8.070 3.000 1 1.98
API WL: 18.00 ES: MON-MAG DRILL COLLAR 7.880 2.940 1 30.56
HTHP WL: ECD: 3TRING STABILIZER 17.000 2.440 1 7.22
Cake API I HTHP: 2.0 / nl K: / 3ROSSOVER 9.500 3.000 1 1.47Solids I Sol Corr: / 1.20 Carbonate:
Oil I Water: 0.0 / 98.8 Bicarbonate: 3HOCK SUB 9.130 2.880 1 9.84

Sand: 0.00 Form Loss: 0.0 / 0.0 3ROSSOVER 9.630 2.810 1 3.00
Water Added: Fluid Disch: / JRILL COLLAR 8.000 3.000 1 122.13
Oil Added: DROSSOVER 6.630 3.000 1 2.80
LGS: 1.20 / 10.80 HWDP 5.000 2.625 4 123.06
VG Meter: 3@3 / 8@6 / 22@300 / 44(cl600 i
Comments: MIXED 10SX SODIUM 3|CARD, BUILT 100BBL LCM |Total Length: 1,054.00 ft Wt below Jars: 45,973.0 kip
SWEEP,DRILLING AHEAD

MUD PRC DUCTS
Product Units Qty Used

ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00
FIBER-SEAL 40 LBSlŠK 10.00
NEW CARB 50 LB/SX 10.00
NEW PHPA 5 GAL 1.00
PALLETS EA. 19.00
SAWDUST 2000 LBS/SK 15.00
SHRINK WRAP EA. 18.00
SODIUM BICARB 50 LBlŠX 10.00!
TAX 1 100.54
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OXY USA

DAILYOPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 10/31/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 36

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 6:00 6.00 06PREE RIGMT REP P RECElVE "MOTHER BOARD" FOR TOP DRIVE, INSTALLSAME AND TEST.

PREPARE TO SPUD WELL. MAKE FINAL PRE-SPUD CHECK.
6:00 12:00 6.00 06PREE RIGMT REP P CONTINUE INSTALL &TEST "MOTHER BOARD"

12:00 14:00 2.00 06PRES RIGMT REP P "MOTHER BOARD" OPERATING. CHECK JCT. BOX ON TOP DRIVE, O.K.. CLIMB
DERRICK 8:CHECK ELEC. INTEGRITY@CROWN.

14:00 14:30 0.50 06PRES SAFE PJSM P PRE-SPUD MEETING - ATTENDED BYALL PERSONNEL
14:30 17:30 3.00 37RDPF RIGMT SRVRIG P INSTALL AND TIGHTEN ALLTOP DRIVECLAMPS. INSTALLTOP DRIVE COVER.

17:30 18:00 0.50 14SUDF DRLOUT DOCMT P BREAKCIRC., CHECK FOR LEAKS, NONE DETECTED, COMMENCE DRILL-OUT
CEMENT.

18:00 19:30 1.50 14SUDF DRILL HOURM P FINISH DRllLL CMT TO 1,135'.
19:30 0:00 4.50 14SUDF DRILL RSS P DRILLINGAHEADWI CONNECTIONS FROM 1,135' TO 1,211'-76' OR 16.8 FT/HR.

WOKE-UP TOOL.
Total Time 24.00

Safety Inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 23.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 23.00 CLEAR, WINDS - MILD, TEMP -49 DEGREES
Incident Comments:
No incidents reported last 24 hours.

Other Remarks: JAMllE HUFF - ELECTRICIAN, TO REMAINON LOCATIONFOR 3 DAYS IN EVENT OF PROBLEMS. APPROVED BY NABORS
DRLG SUPT., LEE HUTCHESON.

11/7/2008 1:39:50PM Page 2 of



OXY IUSA

CONFIDENTIALDAILYOPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date 11/01/2008

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 37

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB @7,920.00ft DFS: 1.19
Today's MD: 1,606.0 ft Progress: 395.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 1,211.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 20.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 19.7 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: VOLCANICS@1,135.0 Lithology: TERTIARYVOLCANICS
Current Ops: DRILLINGAHEADW/ CONNECTIONS
24-Hr Summary: DRILLED 17.5" HOLE FROM 1211' TO 1606'
24-Hr Forecast: CONTINUE TO DRILL TO'NARDS SURFACE TD OF 3000'

CASINGlWELL CONTROL HOOKLOAD & TORQUIE HYDRAULICS MUDGAS Avg Max
Last Casing: 20.000in @1,135ft Str Wt UplDn: 165.0/ 160.0 kip Pump Rate: 753.5 Conn: 0
Next Casing: 13.375in @3,000ft Str Wt Rot: 136.0 kip Pump Press: 1,300.0 Trip: 0
Last BOP Press Test: 01/01/2000 Torq Off Btm: 1,000.0 ft-Ibf Backgr: 0
Form Test/EMW: Torq On Btm: 6,000.0 ft-Ibt

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA(LAST 6)
Supervisor j DUB CAMERON MD incl Azi TVD NI-S EllW VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2: 1,585.0 0.03 171.18 1,585.00 1.3 -0.5 1.3 0.03 0.00
Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 1,490.0 0.03 114.92 1,490.00 1.3 -0.5 1.3 0.09 -0.03

Geologist: KIRKSPARKMAN 1,396.0 0.06 316.11 1,396.00 1.3 -0.5 1.3 0.10 0.02
Oxy Personnel: 0 1,301.0 0.04 89.98 1,301.00 1.2 -0.5 1.2 0.10 -0.06

Contractor Personnel: 21 1,174.0 0.12 351.99 1,174.00 1.1 -0.6 1.1 0.05 -0.05

Total on Site: 21 990.0 0.22 349.17 990.00 0.6 -0.5 0.6 0.17 0.16
BIT RECORD

Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R
Code

1 17.500 HUGHES CHRISTE GTX-CO9 6071441 435 1x18, 3x16 1,135.0 2,782.0 2-1-WT-A E-1-WT-TQ

\ \ \
BIT OPERATING PARAMETERS TODAY

Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP' WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI
Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

1 20.00 24.50 395Í 506.0 19.7 20.7 8.0/15.0 40/65 0.83 903. 344.8 2.0

MUD DATA - NENPARK-AVA LAST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: ED MCDANIEL MBT: 12.0 lbm/bbl BHANo: #1 Bit No: 1 MD In: 1,135.0 ft
Sample From: PIT pH: 9.0 Pu ose: ROTARYSTEERABLE "PUSH THE BIT" MDOut: 2,782.0 ft
Mud Type: LOW SOLIDS / NON-DISP Pm / Pom:

rp

Time / MD: 0:01 / 1,560.0 Pf I Mf: 0.5 / 0.8 Component OD ID Jts Len¶th

Density @Temp: 8.60 / 77 Chlorides: 450 TRI-CONE BIT 17.500 3.750 1 1.32

Rheology Temp: 77 Ca+ / K+: / RSS (PUSH BIT) 9.500 3.200 1 14.02
Viscosity: 60.00 CaCl2: 3TRING STABILIZER 17.375 2.440 1 8.09
PV I YP: 14 / 17 Clom: V1WDTOOL 8.310 6.250 1 26.47
Gels 10s/10m/30m:11 / 17 / 25 Lime: 3AVER SUB 8.070 3.000 1 1.98
API WL: 12.50 ES: MON-MAG DRILLCOLLAR 7.880 2.940 1 30.56
HTHP WL: ECD: 8.61 3TRING STABILIZER 17.000 2.440 1 7.22
Cake API I HTHP: 2.0 / n / K /
Solids I Sol Corr: 2.00 / 2.00 Carbonate: DROSSOVER 9.500 3.000 1 1.47

Oil I Water: 0.0 / 98.0 Bicarbonate: 3HOCK SUB 9.130 2.880 1 9.84

Sand: 0.01 Form Loss: 0.0 / 0.0 DROSSOVER 9.630 2.810 1 3.00
Water Added: Fluid Disch: / JRILL COLLAR 8.000 3.000 1 122.13

Oil Added: 3ROSSOVER 6.630 3.000 1 2.80
LGS: 2.00 / 18.14 1WDP 5.000 2.625 4 123.06
VG Meter: 7@3 / 8@6 / 18@100 / 25 200 / 31@300 / 45@600
Comments: DRILLED FROM 1135 O 1560, OTHER LOSSES ARE Total Length: 1,054.00 ft Wt below Jars: 45,973.0 kip
FROM PASON RE-CALIBRATINGPITS. REDUCED PVT BY 140BBLS

MUD PRC DUCTS
Product Units Qty Used

AQUA BLOC 50 LBS/SK 5.00
DYNA-FIBER 25 LBS 15.00
ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00
FIBER-SEAL 40 LBS/SK 20.00
FLOW-ZAN 25 LB SX 9.00
NEW CARB 50 LB/SX 5.00
NEW PHPA 5 GAL 6.00
NEWEASE 203 5 GALICN 1.00
SAWDUST 2000 LBS/SK 15.00
TAX 1 284.38
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OXY USA

DAI t0PERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
PEDIRÏlEl G PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 1/200

RIG DRIIIJEl USA Report No:

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 3:00 3.00 14SUDF DRILL RSS P DRILLAHEADWI CONNECTIONS FROM 1,211' TO 1,243'.
3:00 3:30 0.50 14SUDF RIGMT SRVRIG P NORMAL RIIGSERVICE

3:30 6:00 2.50 14SUDF DRILL RSS P DRILLAHEADWI CONNECTIONS FROM 1,243' TO 1,337 OR 94' IN2.5HRS OR
37.6'lHR.

6:00 9:00 3.00 14SUDF RIGMT REP PT #1 &#2 PUMPS DOWN. REFIT LINERS IN BOTH.
9:00 14:30 5.50 14SUDF DRILL RSS P COMMENCE DRILLINGAFTER REPAIRS - DRILLFROM 1,33T TO 1,436' OR 99' IN

5.5 HRS OR 18'lHR.
14:30 15:30 1.00 14SUDF RIGMT SRVRIG PT CIRC. FOR 10 MIN.WHILEWORKING PlPE. LUBETOP DRIVE & REGULAR RIG

SERVICE. BREAKCIRC. & ROTATE - MSE SCHOOL & CALIBRATIONSWl PASSON
TECH.

15:30 0:00 8.50 14SUDF DRILL RSS P DRILLINGAHEAD W/ CONNECTIONS FROM 1,436' TO 1,606' OR 170' IN 6.5 HRS
OR 26'lHR.

Total Time 24.00
Safety Inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 24.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 24.00 OVERCAST WINDS FROM S/W. TEMP: 43 DEGREES
Incident Comments:
No incidents reported last 24 hours.
Other Remarks:
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OXYUSA

CONFIDENTIALDAILYOPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35 1 Date: 11/02/2008

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 38

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB @7,920.00ft DFS: 2.19
Today's MD: 2,010.0 ft Progress: 404.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 1,606.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 23.50 hr AFE MD/Days: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 17.2 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: VOLCANICS@1,135.0 Lithology: TERTIARY VOLCANICS
Current Ops: DRILLINGAHEAD W/ CONNECTIONS
24-Hr Summary: DRILLED 17.5" HOLE FROM 1606' TO 2010'
24-Hr Forecast: CONTINUE TO DRILLAH lADTO TD OF 3,000+'.

CASINGlWELL CONTROL HOOKLOAD& TORQUE HYDRAULICS MUD GAS Avg Max
Last Casing: 20.000in @1,135ft Str Wt UplDn: 165.0/ 160.0 kip Pump Rate: 787.0 Conn:
Next Casing: 13.375in @3,000ft Str Wt Rot: 136.0 kip Pump Press: 1,800.0 Trip:
Last BOP Press Test: 01/01/2000 Torq Off Btm: 1,000.0 ft-Ibf Backgr:
Form Test/EMW: Torq On Btm: 6,000.0 ft-Ibf

ÉikSÓNNEL SURVEY DATA(LAST 6)

Supervisor 1: DUB CAMERON MD Incl Azi TVD NI-S El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2: 1,966.0 0.06 15.47 1,966.00 1.4 -0.6 1.4 0.01 0.00
Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 1,871.0 0.06 4.81 1,871.00 1.3 -0.6 1.3 0.08 0.00
Geologist: KIRKSPARKMAN 1,775.0 0.06 285.56 1,775.00 1.2 -0.6 1.2 0.05 0.03
Oxy Personnel: 0 1,679.0 0.03 224.68 1,679.00 1.2 -0.5 1.2 0.03 0.00
Contractor Personnel: 21 1,585.0 0.03 171.18 1,585.00 1.3 -0.5 1.3 0.03 0.00
Total on Site: 21 1,490.0 0.03 114.92 1,490.00 1.3 -0.5 1.3 0.09 -0.03

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
1 17.500 HUGHES CHRISTE GTX-CO9 6071441 435 1x18, 3x16 1,135.0 2,782.0 2-1-WT-A E-l-WT-TQ

\||
BIT OPERATING PARAMETERS TODAY

Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI
Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

1 23.50 48.00 404Í 910.0 17.2 19.C 20.0/30.0 84/92 0.838 835.1 329.4 1.7

MUD DATA NENPARK-AVA LAST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: ED MCDANIEL/DAVEOWE MBT: 17.0 lbm/bbl BHA No: #1 Bit No: 1 MD In: 1,135.0 ft
Sample From: OUT pH: 9.0 Pu ose: ROTARYSTEERABLE "PUSH THE BIT" MD Out: 2,782.0 ft
Mud Type: LOW SOLIDS / NON-DISP Pm / Pom:

rg

Time / MD: 0:01 / 1,966.0 Pf I Mf: 0.2 / 0.5 Component OD ID Jts Len¶th

Density @Temp: 8.60 / 97 Chlorides: 500 TRI-CONEBIT 17.500 3.750 1 1.32

Rheology Temp: 97 Ca+ / K+: I RSS (PUSH BIT) 9.500 3.200 1 14.02
Viscosity: 55.00 CaCl2: 3TRING STABILIZER 17.375 2.440 1 8.09
PV I YP: 15 / 19 Clom: vlWD TOOL 8.310 6.250 1 26.47
Gels 10s/10m/30m:7 / 18 / 22 Lime: 3AVER SUB 8.070 3.000 1 1.98
API WL: 11.00 ES: MON-MAGDRILLCOLLAR 7.880 2.940 1 30.56
HTHP WL: ECD: 8.66 3TRING STABILIZER 17.000 2.440 1 7.22
Cake API I HTHP· 2.0 / n I K· /
Solids / Sol Corr: / 2.00 Carbonate: ROSSOVER 9.500 3.000 1 1.47

Oil / Water: 0.0 / 98.0 Bicarbonate: 3HOCK SUB 9.130 2.880 1 9.84
Sand: 0.25 Form Loss: 121.0 / 121.0 3ROSSOVER 9.630 2.810 1 3.00
Water Added: Fluid Disch: / 3RILLCOLLAR 8.000 3.000 1 122.13
Oil Added: 3ROSSOVER 6.630 3.000 1 2.80
LGS: 2.00 / 18.14 -lWDP 5.000 2.625 4 123.06
VG Meter: 8@3 / 8@6 / 20@100 / 28 200 / 34@300 / 49@600
Comments: DRILLEDFROM 1560FT TO 1966 FT. REMOVED SLUG Total Length: 1,054.00 ft Wt below Jars: 45,973.0 kip
PIT VOLUME FROM PVT ON PASON TO CORRECT PVT TO 750BBLS.
LOST AND REBUILT300BBLS TO HOLE.

MUDPRC DUCTS
Product Units Qty Used

AQUA BLOC 50 LBS/SK 4.00
CAUSTIC SODA 50 LB/SX 4.00
ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00
FIBER-SEAL 40 LBS/SK 30.00
FLOW-ZAN 25 LB SX 4.00
NEW CARB 50 LB/SX 27.00
NEW GEL HY 50 LBS/SK 174.00
NEW PHPA 5 GAL 7.00
SAWDUST 2000 LBS/SK 40.00
TAX 1 264.71

11/7/2008 1:51:05PM Page 1 of



OXY USA

DAILYOPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 11/02/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 38

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 6:00 6.00 14SUDF DRILL RSS P DRILLAHEAD FROM 1,606' TO 1,731' OR 125' IN 6 HRS OR 21'lHR.
6:00 6:30 0.50 14SUDF RIGMT SRVRIG P RIG SERVICE
6:30 0:00 17.50 14SUDF DRILL RSS P DRILLAHEADFROM 1,731' TO 2,010' OR 279' IN 11.5 HRS OR 25'lHR.
Total Time 24.00

Safety Incident? N Days since Last RI: 25.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 25.00 OVERCAST - WINDS S/W - GUSTY. TEMP: 45 DEGREES

Incident Comments:
No incidents reported last 24 hours.

Other Remarks: FUEL USAGE - 1,908 GALS. MUST CHANGE DRLG PARAMETERS FOR FORMATIONCHANGES THROUGH-OUT DAY.
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OXY USA

CONFIDENTIALDAILYOPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
PLATEAU VALLEY FEDERAL 35-1 Date: 11/03/2008

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 39

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB @7,920.00ft DFS: 3.19
Today's MD: 2,405.0 ft Progress: 395.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 2,010.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 20.00 hr AFE MD/Days: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 19.7 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: VOLCANICS@1,135.0 Lithology: TERTIARYVOLCANICS
Current Ops: DRILLINGAHEADW/ CONNECTIONS
24-Hr Summary: CONTROL DRILL 17.5" HOLE. ADJUST WI FORMATIONCHANGES
24-Hr Forecast: CONTINUE TO DRILL AHTADTO TD OF 3,000 +'.

CÁSINGlWELL CONTROL H00KLOAD &TORQUE HYDRAULICS MUDGA Av Max
Last Casing: 20.000in @1,135ft Str Wt Up/Dn: 165.0/ 160.0 kip Pump Rate: 0.0 Conn: 0 0
Next Casing: 13.375in @3,000ft Str Wt Rot: 136.0 kip Pump Press: 0.0 Trip: 0 0

Last BOP Press Test: 01/01/2000 Torq Off Btm: 1,000.0 ft-Ibt Backgr: 0 0
Form Test/EMW: Torq On Btm: 6,000.0 ft-Ibf

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA(LAST 6)
Supervisor 1: DUB CAMERON NID Incl Azi TVO NI-S El-W AS DLS Build
Supervisor 2: 2,347.0 0.04 13.52 2,347.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.00 0.00
Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 2,347.0 0.04 13.52 2,347.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.00 0.00
Geologist: KIRKSPARKMAN 2,252.0 0.04 13.73 2,252.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.06 -0.05

Oxy Personnel: 0 2,252.0 0.04 13.73 2,252.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.06 -0.05

Contractor Personnel: 26 2,156.0 0.09 42.27 2,156.00 1.5 -0.5 1.5 0.07 0.06
Total on Site: 26 2,156.0 0.09 42.47 2,156.00 1.5 -0.5 1.5 0.00 0.00

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
1 17.500 HUGHES CHRISTE GTX-CO9 6071441 435 1x18, 3x16 1,135.0 2,782.0 2-1-WT-A E-1-WT-TQ

\
BIT OPERATING PARAMETERS TODAY

Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI
Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

1 23.50 71.50 377.C 1,287.0 16. 18.C 16.0/38.0 60/90 0.838 740. 310.3 1.5

MUDDATA - NENPARK-AVA LAST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: McDANIEL / OWENS MBT: BHA No: # 1 Bit No: 1 MD In: 1,135.0 ft
Sample From: PIT pH: Pur ose: ROTARY STEERABLE "PUSH THE BIT" MD Out: 2,782.0 ft
Mud Type: LOW SOLIDS / NON-DISP Pm / Pom:
Time I MD: 0:01 / 2,375.0 Pf I Mf: / Component OD ID Jts Len¶th

Density @Temp: 8.70 / 105 Chlorides: TRI-CONE BIT 17.500 3.750 1 1.32

Rheology Temp: 90 Ca+ / K+: / RSS (PUSH BIT) 9.500 3.200 1 14.02
Viscosity: 61.00 CaCl2: STRING STABILIZER 17.375 2.440 1 8.09
PV I YP: 15 / 19 Clom: VlWD TOOL 8.310 6.250 1 26.47
Gels 10s/10m/30m:11 / 25 / 29 Lime: SAVER SUB 8.070 3.000 1 1.98
API WL: 10.00 ES: NON-MAG DRILLCOLLAR 7.880 2.940 1 30.56
HTHP WL: ECD: 8.74 STRING STABILIZER 17.000 2.440 1 7.22
Cake API I HTHP: 2.0 / n / K /
Solids / Sol Corr: / Carbonate: :3ROSSOVER 9.500 3.000 1 1.47

Oil I Water: I 97.3 Bicarbonate: SHOCK SUB 9.130 2.880 1 9.84

Sand: 0.29 Form Loss: / 121.0 :3ROSSOVER 9.630 2.810 1 3.00

Water Added: Fluid Disch: / DRILL COLLAR 8.000 3.000 1 122.13
Oil Added: OROSSOVER 6.630 3.000 1 2.80
LGS: / -lWDP 5.000 2.625 4 123.06
VG Meter: 5@3 / 7@6 / 11@100 / 25 200 / 33@300 / 49@600 i

Comments: DRILLEDFROM 1'966ET TO 2375FT. STILL Total Length: 1,054.00 ft Wt below Jars: 45,973.0 kip
EXPERIENCING MINOR SEEPAGES OF 25BBLS AND STILL PUMPING i
LCM SWEEPS.

MUDPRC DUCTS
Product Units QtY Used

AQUA BLOC 50 LBS/SK 1.00
CAUSTIC SODA 50 LB/SX 4.00
DYNA-FIBER 25 LBS 1.00
ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00
NEW CARB 50 LB/SX 32.00
NEW GEL 100 LBS/SK 70.00
NEW PHPA 5 GAL 6.00
SAWDUST 2000 LBS/SK 50.00
TAX 1 118.06
TRUCKING SERVICE EACH 1,502.46
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OXY USA

LY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
n : EXPL gli I PLATEAUVALLEY FEDERAL 35-1 Date: 11/03/2008

tim Èason:ORIÑDRIl I El USA Report No: 39

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 6:00 6.00 14SUDF DRILL RSS P DRLG FROM 2,010' TO 2,108' OR 98' IN 6 HRS OR 17'lHR. WOB -28K; RPM -80;

GPM - 757.
6:00 8:30 2.50 14SUDF DRILL RSS P DRLG FROM 2,108' TO 2,128' @8'lHR. ROP INCREASES TO 54' PER HR. WOB -

30K; RPM - 80; GPM 757.
8:30 12:00 3.50 14SUDF DRILL RSS P DRILLAHEADFROM 2,128' TO 2,212' OR 84' IN 3.5HRS OR 25'lHR. BIT WT - 25K;

RPM - 87.
12:00 16:30 4.50 14SUDF DRILL RSS P DRILLFROM 2,212' TO 2,298' OR 86' IN4.4 HRS OR 19'lHR.
16:30 17:00 0.50 14SUDF RIGMT SRVRIG P RIG SERVICE
17:00 0:00 7.00 14SUDF DRILL RSS P DRILLFROM 2,298' TO 2,405' OR 107' IN7 HRS OR 15.2'lHR. WOB - 30K; RPM -78;

GPM - 810.
Total Time 24.00

Safety Inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 26.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 26.00 OVERCAST; WINDS CALM; TEMP -28 DEGREES.
Incident Comments:
No incidents reported last 24 hours.
Other Remarks: DIESEL USED -2,544 GALS. DIESEL 0 9 HAND - 14,416 GALS.
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' CONFIDENTIALDAILYOPERATIONS ARTNER REPORT
, PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: 11/04/2008

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILL VERT USA Report No: 40

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINALKB @7,920.00ft DFS: 4.19
Today's MD: 2,703.0 ft Progress: 298.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 2,405.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 21.50 hr AFE MD/Days: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 13.9 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: TERTIARY@1,135.0 Lithology: BLACK CAP MTN @2,552.
Current Ops: DRILLAHEADTO SURFACE HOLE TD OF 3,000'. FORM: CHANGES EVERY 3-5'.
24-Hr Summary: CONTINUE TO DRILLAHEADW/ CONNECTIONS
24-Hr Forecast: CONTINUE TO DRILL AH ¡AD WI CONNECTIONS TO 3,000+'.

CASINGlWELL CONTROL HOOKLOAD &TORQUE HYDRAULICS MUDGAS Av¶ Max
Last Casing: 20.000in @1,135ft Str Wt UplDn: 165.0/ 160.0 kip Pump Rate: 410.2 Conn: 0 0
Next Casing: 13.375in @3,000ft Str Wt Rot: 136.0 kip Pump Press: 1,493.0 Trip: 0 0
Last BOP Press Test: 01/01/2000 Torq Off Btm: 1,000.0 ft-Ibf Backgr: 0 0
Form Test/EMW: Torq On Btm: 6,000.0 ft-Ibt

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA(LAST 6)

Supervisor 1: DUB CAMERON MD Incl Azi TVD NI-S El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2: 2,631.0 0.06 349.56 2,631.00 1.8 -0.5 1.8 0.04 0.02
Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 2,536.0 0.04 313.11 2,536.00 1.7 -0.4 1.7 0.04 0.04
Geologist: KIRKSPARKMAN 2,443.0 0.00 12.15 2,443.00 1.7 -0.4 1.7 0.04 -0.04

Oxy Personnel: 0 2,347.0 0.04 13.52 2,347.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.00 0.00
Contractor Personnel: 25 2,347.0 0.04 13.52 2,347.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.00 0.00
Total on Site: 25 2,252.0 0.04 13.73 2,252.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.06 -0.05

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
1 17.500 HUGHES CHRISTE GTX-CO9 6071441 435 1x18, 3x16 1,135.0 2,782.0 2-1-WT-A E-1-WT-TQ

BIT OPERATING PARAMETERS TODAY
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max
1 21.50 116.50 298.( 1,962.0 13.9 16. 27.0/36.0 67/73 0.838 749. 310.3 1.5

MUD DATA - NENPARK-AVA LAST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: ED MCDANIEL/DAVE OWE MBT: 30.0 lbm/bbl BHA No: #1 Bit No: 1 MD In: 1,135.0 ft
Sample From: OUT pH: 9.0 Purpose: ROTARY STEERABLE "PUSH THE BIT" MD Out: 2 782.0 ft
Mud Type: LOW SOLIDS / NON-DISP Pm / Pom: Com onent OD ID Jts Len th
Time / MD: 0:01 / 2,710.0 Pf / Mf: 0.4 / 0.6
Density @Temp: 8.70 / 102 Chlorides: 300 ERI-CONE BIT 17.500 3.750 1 1.32
Rheology Temp: 102 Ca+ / K+: / RSS (PUSH BIT) 9.500 3.200 1 14.02
Viscosity: 63.00 CaCl2: 3TRING STABILIZER 17.375 2.440 1 8.09
PV I YP: 20 / 15 Clom: VlWD TOOL 8.310 6.250 1 26.47
Gels 10s/10m/30m:12 / 25 / 32 Lime: 3AVER SUB 8.070 3.000 1 1.98
API WL: 9.00 ES: MON-MAGDRILLCOLLAR 7.880 2.940 1 30.56
HTHP WL: ECD: 8.75 3TRING STABILIZER 17.000 2.440 1 7.22
Cake API / HTHP: 2.0 / nl K: / ,-ROSSOVER 9.500 3.000 1 1.47Solids I Sol Corr: / Carbonate:
Oil I Water: 0.0 / 97.3 Bicarbonate: 3HOCK SUB 9.130 2.880 1 9.84

Sand: 0.30 Form Loss: 29.0 / 150.0 DROSSOVER 9.630 2.810 1 3.00
Water Added: Fluid Disch: / JRILL COLLAR 8.000 3.000 1 122.13
Oil Added: 3ROSSOVER 6.630 3.000 1 2.80
LGS: 2.70 / 24.50 -lWDP 5.000 2.625 4 123.06
VG Meter: 7@3 / 8@6 / 18@100 / 23(01200 / 35@300 / 55@600
Comments: DRILLED FROM 2375 O 2710. Total Length: 1,054.00 ft Wt below Jars: 45,973.0 kip

MUD PRC DUCTS
Product Units Qty Used

DYNA-FIBER 25 LBS 5.00
ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00
NEW CARB 50 LB/SX 25.00
NEW GEL 100 LBS/SK 10.00
NEW PHPA 5 GAL 4.00
PALLETS EA. 18.00
SAWDUST 2000 LBS/SK 15.00
SHRINK WRAP EA. 18.00
TAX 1 122.94
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OXY USA

DAILYOPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 11/04/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No; 40

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 6:00 6.00 14SUDF DRILL RSS P DRILLFROM 2,405' TO 2,495' OR 90' IN6 HRS OR 15'lHR. BITWT - 37K; RPM - 80;

GPM - 810; PP - 1,800.
6:00 12:00 6.00 14SUDF DRILL RSS P DRILLFROM 2,495' TO 2,593' OR 99' IN6 HRS OR 16.5'lHR. ROP DROPS TO

5.6'lHR.
12:00 14:30 2.50 14SUDF DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 2,593' TO 2,623' OR 30' IN2.5 HRS OR 12'lHR. BITWT -40K; RPM -88;

GPM - 810; PP - 1,821 PSI. TORQUE - 2,000 FTILBS
14:30 15:30 1.00 14SUDF DRILL RSS P DRILLFROM 2,323', ADJUST BITWT AND RPM TO MAKEBIT DRILL.ROP -7.9'lHR.

PICK-UP OFF BOTTOM AND SET BACK DOWN TO MAKE BIT "BITE". CONSULT WI
MUD LOGGER. INFORMED ME THATWE WERE IN ARAPIEN LIMESTONE.
CHANGE DRLG PARAMETERS TO "HARD ROCK".

15:30 16:00 0.50 14SUDF DRILL RSS P DRILLAHEAD FROM 2,629'. BIT WT -26K; RPM -72; GPM - 800; ROP 14.2'lHR.
LOST 200 PSI PMP PRESSURE. CHECK-OUT PUMPS- NO PROBLEM. P/U OFF
BTM - NO DRAG. BACK TO BTMAND DRILL.

16:00 16:30 0.50 14SUDF DRILL RSS P CONTINUE TO ANALYZE PROBLEM WHILE DRLG. FROM 2,630'. PUMP #2
SUCKING AIR. CHANGE TO PUMPS #1 & 3. CONTINUE TO DRILL AHEAD FROM
2,633' - ROP 10.5'lHR.

16:30 0:00 7.50 14SUDF DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 2,633' TO 2,703' OR 70' IN7.5HRS OR9.6'lHR. BITWT - 34K; RPM - 67;
GPM - 810; PP - 1960; TORQUE - 2,000.

Total time 24.0C
Safety Inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 27.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 27.00 LIGHT SNOW -4"; TEMP: 20 DEGREES
Incident Comments:
No incidents reported last 24 hours.
Other Remarks: DIESEL USED: 2,968 GALS. DIESEL ON HAND:10,388 GALS.

11/7/2008 1:57:09PM Page 2 of



CONFIDENTIALDAILYOPERATIONS ARTNER REPORT
PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 11/05/2008

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 41

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINALKB @7,920.00ft DFS: 5.19
Today's MD: 2,783.0 ft Progress: 80.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 2,703.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 10.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 8.0 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: TERTIARY@2,552.0 Lithology: BLACKCAP MOUNTAIN. SAND,LIMESTONE,CLAY & VOLCANK

Current Ops: DRILLAHEAD TO SURFACE TD OF 3,000'.
24-Hr Summary: DRILL AHEAD W/ FORMATIONCHANGES EVERY 3-5'.
24-Hr Forecast: CONTINUETO DRILLAH =AD W/ DRILLINGPARAMETERS.

CAalNO2WEIICONTROL HOÖKLOAD TORQUE HYDRAULICS MUDGAS Avp Max
Last Casing: 20.000in @ 1,135ft Str Wt Up/Dn: 165.0/ 160.0 kip Pump Rate: 0.0 Conn:
Next Casing: 13.375in @3,000ft Str Wt Rot: 136.0 kip Pump Press: 0.0 Trip:
Last BOP Press Test: 01/01/2000 Torq Off Btm: 1,000.0 ft-Ibf Backgr:
Form Test/EMW: Torq On Btm: 6,000.0 ft-Ibt

PERG NEL SURVEY DATA(LAST 6)
Supervisor 1: DUB CAMERON MD Incl Azi TVD NI-S El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2: ROD MANIACI 2,631.0 0.06 349.56 2,631.00 1.8 -0.5 1.8 0.04 0.02
Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 2,536.0 0.04 313.11 2,536.00 1.7 -0.4 1.7 0.04 0.04
Geologist: KIRKSPARKMAN 2,443.0 0.00 12.15 2,443.00 1.7 -0.4 1.7 0.04 -0.04

Oxy Personnel: 0 2,347.0 0.04 13.52 2,347.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.00 0.00
Contractor Personnel: 27 2,347.0 0.04 13.52 2,347.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.00 0.00
Total on Site: 27 2,252.0 0.04 13.73 2,252.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.06 -0.05

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out 1-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
1 17.500 HUGHES CHRISTE GTX-CO9 6071441 435 1x18, 3x16 1,135.0 2,782.0 2-1-WT-A E-l-WT-TQ

\ C

0

BIT OPERATING PARAMETERS TQDAY
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog um Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max
1 10.00 148.00 1,648. 3,908. 164.8 26.4 25.0/36.0 60/80 0.83 1,043. 348.6 2.3

MUD DATA NE.NPARIGAVA LA$TOR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: ED MCDANIELINICK LIGH MBT: 32.5 lbm/bbl |BHA No: # 1 Bit No: 1 MD In: 1,135.0 ft
Sample From: PIT pH: 8.4 |Pu ose: ROTARY STEERABLE "PUSH THE BIT" MD Out: 2,782.0 ft
Mud Type: LOW SOLIDS / NON-DISP Pm / Pom:

rp

Time / MD: 0:01 / 2,805.0 Pf I Mf: 0.1 / 0.5 Component OD ID Jts Length

Density @ Temp: 8.90 / 80 Chlorides: 300 TRI-CONE BIT 17.500 3.750 1 1.32

Rheology Temp: 80 Ca+ / K+: / RSS (PUSH BIT) 9.500 3.200 1 14.02
Viscosity: 60.00 CaCl2: 3TRING STABILIZER 17.375 2.440 1 8.09
PV I YP: 17 / 20 Clom: VlWD TOOL 8.310 6.250 1 26.47
Gels 10s/10m/30m:7 / 22 / 30 Lime: 3AVER SUB 8.070 3.000 1 1.98
API WL: 10.20 ES: MON-MAG DRILLCOLLAR 7.880 2.940 1 30.56
HTHP WL: ECD: 8.90 3TRING STABILIZER 17.000 2.440 1 7.22
Cake API I HTHP 2.0 / n / K /
Solids I Sol Corr: I4.20 Carbonate: 3ROSSOVER 9.500 3.000 1 1.47

Oil I Water: I 95.8 Bicarbonate: 3HOCK SUB 9.130 2.880 1 9.84

Sand: 0.30 Form Loss: 47.0 / 197.0 DROSSOVER 9.630 2.810 1 3.00

Water Added: Fluid Disch: / 3RILL COLLAR 8.000 3.000 1 122.13

Oil Added: DROSSOVER 6.630 3.000 1 2.80
LGS: / 4.20 HWDP 5.000 2.625 4 123.06
VG Meter: 6@3 /7@6 / 22@100 / 30 200 / 37@300 / 54@600 i
Comments: DRILLED FROM 2710 TO 2805, (12 HRS); DECISION Total Length: 1,054.00 ft Wt below Jars: 45,973.0 kip
vvkõ iviADE TO lOOH FOR NEvv Biï. PUIviPED EvvEEP AÑÜ SLUG ANÜ
PROCEEDED TO POOH. TIGHT HOLE @2495 NECESSITATED
BACK-REAMINGFROM 2495 TO 1700.

MUD PRC UCTS
Product Units QtY Used

CAUSTIC SODA 50 LB/SX 6.00
ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00
NEW BAR 100 LB/SX 80.00
NEW PHPA 5 GAL 2.00
SALT 50 LB/SX 3.00
TAX 1 1.00
TRUCKING SERVICE EACH 1.00

I
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OXY USA

DAl liiRATIONS.PARTNER REPORT
t: EXPL DRIL \ÎÅTEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: ilOS/20g8

I Reason RIG DRlLI VE USA Re RN 4tl

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 0:30 0.50 14SUDF RIGMT SRVRIG P RIG SERVICE
0:30 6:00 5.50 14SUDF DRILL RSS P DRILL AHEAD FROM 2,703' TO 2,761' OR 58' IN 5.5 HRS. OR 10.6'lHR. BIT WT: 34K;

RPM: 63; GPM: 810; PP: 1,920 PSl; TORQUE: 2,000 FTILBS. FORMATION
CHANGINGiEVERY3-5'. MAINTAINSAME DRLG PARAMETERS THROUGH-OUT.

6:00 10:30 4.50 14SUDF DRILL RSS P DRILLAHEADFROM 2,761' TO 2,782' OR 22' IN 4.5 HRS OR OR 4.8'lHR. MWD -

STICK & SLIP @2,780' TO 2,783'. CONTACT DRLG SUPT. &ADVISE.
10:30 13:30 3.00 14SUDF RIGMT REP PT INSTALLFILLLINETO POOH. MIXSLUG. COULD NOT PUMP SLUG. ALL

ATTEMPTS FAIL.R/U MUDBUCKETTO ACTIVE SYSTEM.
13:30 17:30 4.00 14SUDF TRIP DRILL P POOH FOR BIT#2. DRAG BHAOUT OF HOLE FROM 2,495' TO 1940'. DID NOT

PULL OVER 20K & BACKREAMTHROUGH ENTIRE INTERVAL.
17:30 19:00 1.50 14SUDF TRIP DRILL P CONTINUE OUT OF HOLE. BEGIN DRAGGING@1,840'. KELLY-UPAND BACK

REAMTO 1705'
19:00 0:00 5.00 14SUDF TRIP DRILL P TRIP OUT FROM 1705'
Total Time 24.00

Safety Inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 28.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 28.00 CLEAR. / TEMP 22 DEGREES / 13 MPH NNW
Incident Comments:
No incidents reported last 24 hours.

Other Remarks: NO ACCIDENTS, NO SPILLS
DIESEL USED: 1,908 GALS. DIESEL ON HAND: 12,084 GALS.

11/7/2008 2:01:01PM Page 2 of



CONFIDENTIALDAILYOPERATIO75;
PAARTNER

REPORT
PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 11/06/2008

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 42

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINALKB @7,920.00ft DFS: 6.19
Today's MD: 2,839.0 ft Progress: 56.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 2,783.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 11.50 hr AFE MD/Days: 14,000.0 /98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 4.9 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: TERTIARY@2,552.0 Lithology: BLACK CAP MOUNTAIN
Current Ops: TRIP OUT & INVESTIGATEPRESSURE LOSS
24-Hr Summary: TRIP IN WITH NEW BIT & RSS TOOL / DRILL TO 2839'/ TRIP OUT & INVESTIGATE PRESSURE LOST
24-Hr Forecast: INSPECT DOWN HOLE T JOLS / EVALUATE & MITIGATE AS NEEDED

CASINGlWBOLCONTROL HOOKLOAD & TOROUE HYDRAULICS MUDGAS Avg Max
Last Casing: 20.000in @ 1,135ft Str Wt UplDn: 180.0/ 178.0 kip Pump Rate: 883.3 Conn:
Next Casing: 13.375in @3,000ft Str Wt Rot: 180.0 kip Pump Press: 1,608.0 Trip:
Last BOP Press Test: 01/01/2000 Torq Off Btm: 1,500.0 ft-Ibf Backgr:
Form Test/EMW: Torq On Btm: 2,000.0 ft-Ibf

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA(LAST 6)
Supervisor 1: DUB CAMERON MD Incl Azi TVD NI-S El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2: ROD MANIACI 2,631.0 0.06 349.56 2,631.00 1.8 -0.5 1.8 0.04 0.02
Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 2,536.0 0.04 313.11 2,536.00 1.7 -0.4 1.7 0.04 0.04
Geologist: KIRKSPARKMAN 2,443.0 0.00 12.15 2,443.00 1.7 -0.4 1.7 0.04 -0.04

Oxy Personnel: 0 2,347.0 0.04 13.52 2,347.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.00 0.00
Contractor Personnel: 27 2,347.0 0.04 13.52 2,347.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.00 0.00
Total on Site: 27 2,252.0 0.04 13.73 2,252.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.06 -0.05

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
2 17.500 HUGHES CHRISTE GTX-C20 6068047 515 3x20 2,782.0
1 17.500 HUGHES CHRISTE GTX-CO9 6071441 435 1x18, 3x16 1,135.0 2,782.0 2-1-WT-A E-l-WT-TQ

BIT OPERATING PARAMETERS TODAY
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max
2 11.50 11.50 57.C 57.0 5.0 5.C 25.0/30.0 110/130 0.920 819.C 320.7 1.8
1 10.00 158.00 298.C 4,206.0 29.8 26.6 27.0/36.0 67/73 0.838 785.7 314.1 1.6

MUD DATA - NENPARK-AVA LAST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: ED MCDANIELINICKLIGH¯ MBT: 30.0 lbm/bbl BHA No: 2 Bit No: 2 MD In: 2,782.0 ft
Sample From: PIT pH: 8.5 Purpose: DRILL VERTICAL SURFACE HOLE MD Out:
Mud Type: LOW SOLIDS / NON-DISP Pm I Pom:
Time / MD: 19:30 / 2,825.0 Pf I Mf: 0.1 / 0.5 Component OD ID Jts Len¶th

Density @Temp: 8.70 / 80 Chlorides: 400 FRI-CONEBIT 17.500 3.750 1 1.32

Rheology Temp: 80 Ca+ I K+: / RSS (PUSH BIT) 9.500 3.200 1 14.02
Viscosity: 61.00 CaCl2: 3TRING STABILIZER 17.375 2.440 1 8.09
PV / YP: 15 / 18 Clom: WWD TOOL 8.310 6.250 1 26.47
Gels 10s/10m/30m:7 / 23 / 30 Lime: |3AVER SUB 8.070 3.000 1 1.98
API WL: 10.60 ES: WON-MAGDRILLCOLLAR 7.880 2.940 1 30.56
HTHP WL: ECD: 8.70 STRING STABILIZER 17.000 2.440 1 7.22
Cake API I HTHP: 2.0 / n / K /
Solids I Sol Corr: 2.70 / 2.70 Carbonate: DROSSOVER 9.500 3.000 1 1.47

Oil I Water: / Bicarbonate: 3HOCK SUB 9.130 2.880 1 9.84

Sand: 0.30 Form Loss: 54.0 / 251.0 3ROSSOVER 9.630 2.810 1 3.00
Water Added: Fluid Disch: / 3RILL COLLAR 8.000 3.000 1 122.13
Oil Added: 3ROSSOVER 6.630 3.000 1 2.80
LGS: 2.70 /24.49 |-lWDP 5.000 2.625 4 123.06
VG Meter: 6@3 / 7@6| 20@100 / 28 200 / 33@300 / 48@600 i
Comments: COMPLETED POOH & BIT/BHA CHANGE. TlH AND |Total Length: 1,054.00 ft Wt below Jars: 45,973.0 kip
TAGGED @2780, WITHOUT REAMING IN; HAD 2 FEET OF FILL.

BROKE IN NEW 17.5 BIT AND DRILLINGAHEAD @2834
AT REPORT TIMEWITHOUTLOSSES OR HOLE PROBLEMS.

MUD PRC DUCTS
Product Units Qty Used

CAUSTIC SODA 50 LB/SX 2.00
DYNA-FIBER 25 LBS 29.00
ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00
FLOW-ZAN 25 LB SX 4.00
NEW CARB 50 LB/SX 27.00
NEW PHPA 5 GAL 4.00
PALLETS EA. 18.00
SAWDUST 2000 LBS/SK 30.00|
SHRINK WRAP EA. 18.00.
TAX 1 1.00
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Ever B lb G PLATEAUVÁll ÒERAQ361 Date: 11/06/2008
Prim Reasó I El USÀ Report No: 42

OPERATK)N
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 3:00 3.00 14SUDF TRIP DRILL P TRIP OUT TO BIT
3:00 4:00 1.00 14SUDF TRIP DRILL P CHANGE OUT BIT & RSS TOOL
4:00 6:00 2.00 14SUDF TRIP DRILL P TRIP IN HOLE WITH BHA #2
6:00 7:00 1.00 14SUDF TRIP DRILL P TIH TO 1,100'. BREAKClRC.
7:00 7:30 0.50 14SUDF RIGMT SRVRIG PT RIG SERVICE
7:30 10:00 2.50 14SUDF TRIP DRILL PT INSTALLROTATINGHEAD RUBBER, & CONTINUE IN HOLE. TAG FILL@2,780'. 2'

OF FILL& DRILL-OUT.
10:00 12:00 2.00 14SUDF DRILL RSS P DRILL& FACE BIT, BEGIN INTRODUCING"NEW EASE" INTO DP ON CONN. (1-2

GALS) TO PREVENT BALLINGOF BIT. DRILLFROM 2,783' TO 2,791'.
12:00 14:30 2.50 14SUDF DRILL RSS P DRILLFROM 2,791' W/ 18K ON BIT. 110 RPM &883 GPM WI 1,000 FTILBSTORQUE.

ROP 10'lHR. INCREASE TO 22K ON BIT WI110 RPM, ROP -5'lHR. TOOL STARTED
CREATING HARMONICIMBALANCE& COULD NOT BE READ. P/U OFF BITWT, TO
15K; RPM 110. ROP - 3.4'lHR. INCREASE BITWT TO 18K; 100RPM. ROP -4'lHR.
DECREASE RPM TO 84, INCREASE BITWT TO 23K, ROP - 3.9/HR. TORQUE-2,000.
DEPTH - 2,806. MADE15' IN4.4HRS OR 3.3'lHR.

14:30 15:30 1.00 14SUDF DRILL RSS P DRILLFROM 2,806. BIT WT. 20K; RPM - 100; 883 GPM @1680 PSl; TORQUE
1-2,000 FTILBS. ROP - 3.9; REDUCE BIT WT - 10K; RPM - 105; ROP - 3.9'lHR.

15:30 21:30 6.00 14SUDF DRILL RSS P ADJUST BITWT TO 25-30K; RPM - 105-130; GPM - 930; TORQUE - 2,000FTILBS.
BEST PERFORMING PERAMETERS WERE WOB= 28K, RPM= 125. ROP
INCREASED TO 9'lHR. DRILL FROM 2,815' TO 2839'

21:30 23:00 1.50 14SUDF DRILL RSS PT INVESTIGATEINSTANTANEOUS300 PSI PRESSURE LOSS, INCREASE IN RPMS,
LOWER TORQUE, LOSS OF 8K STRING WEIGHT, AND LOSS OF MWDSIGNAL.

23:00 0:00 1.00 14SUDF TRIP WSHO PT TRIP OUT OF HOLE & INSPECT TOOLS.
Total time 24.0C

Safety Inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 29.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 29.00 CLEAR; WIND 13 MPH NINW; AMBIENTTEMP 22 DEGREES; WIND CHILL10
Incident Comments:
NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED / NO SPILLS REPORTED
Other Remarks: DIESEL USED: 2120 GALS. DIESEL ON HAND: 9964 GALS.
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CONFIDENTIALDAILY OPERATIONS ARTNER REPORT
,

PLATEAUVALLEY FEDERAL 35-1 Date: 11/07/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILL VERT USA Report No: 43

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB @7,920.00ft DFS: 7.19
Today's MD: 2,839.0 ft Progress: 0.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 2,839.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 0.00 hr AFE MD/Days: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 0.0 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: TERTIARY@2,552.0 Lithology: BLACK CAP MOUNTAIN
Current Ops: TRIP IN HOLE WITH FISHING TOOLS
24-Hr Summary: TRIP OUT OF HOLE / WAIT ON FISHING HAND WITH TOOLS /TRIP IN HOLE WITH FISHING TOOLS
24-Hr Forecast: TRIP IN HOLE / RETREVi FISH / TRIP OUT OF THE HOLE LAY DOWN FISH / WIRELINE LOG OPEN HOLE SECTION

CASINGlWELL CONTROL HOOKLOAD & TORQUE : HYDRAULICS MUD GAS Avg Max
Last Casing: 20.000in @ 1,135ft Str Wt UplDn: / Pump Rate: 925.1 Conn:
Next Casing: 13.375in @ 2,810ft Str Wt Rot: Pump Press: 1,900.0 Trip:
Last BOP Press Test: Torq Off Btm: Backgr:
Form Test/EMW: Torq On Btm:

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA (LAST 6)

Supervisor 1: DUBCAMERON MD Incl Azi TVD N/-S El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2: ROD MANIACl 2,631.0 0.06 349.56 2,631.00 1.8 -0.5 1.8 0.04 0.02
Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 2,536.0 0.04 313.11 2,536.00 1.7 -0.4 1.7 0.04 0.04
Geologist: KIRKSPARKMAN 2,443.0 0.00 12.15 2,443.00 1.7 -0.4 1.7 0.05 -0.05

Oxy Personnel: 0 2,347.0 0.05 13.52 2,347.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.01 0.01
Contractor Personnel: 25 2,252.0 0.04 13.73 2,252.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.06 -0.05

Total on Site: 25 2,156.0 0.09 42.27 2,156.00 1.5 -0.5 1.5 0.07 0.06

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
2 17.500 HUGHES CHRISTE GTX-C20 6068047 515 3x20 2,782.0 2,839.0 1-0-BT-M E-l-PN-TD

1 17.500 HUGHES CHRISTE GTX-CO9 6071441 435 1×18, 3x16 1,135.0 2,782.0 2-1-WT-A E-I-WT-TQ

BIT OPERATING PARAMETERS TODAY
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

MUD DATA - NENPARK-AVA LAST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: ED MCDANIELINICK LIGHl MBT: 30.0 lbm/bbl BHA No: 2 Bit No: 2 MD In: 2,782.0 ft
Sample From: PIT pH: 8.5 Purpose: DRILL VERTICAL SURFACE HOLE MD Out: 2 839.0 ft
Mud Type: LOW SOLIDS / NON-DISP Pm I Pom: Com onent OD ID Jts Length
Time I MD: 11:00 / 2,839.0 Pf I Mf: 0.1 / 0.4
Density @Temp: 8.70 / 71 Chlorides: 400 PRI-CONE BIT 17.500 3.750 1 1.32

Rheology Temp: 71 Ca+ / K+: / RSS (PUSH BIT) 9.500 3.200 1 14.02
Viscosity: 63.00 CaCl2: 3TRING STABILIZER 17.375 2.440 1 8.09
PV I YP: 16 / 20 Clom: VIWDTOOL 8.310 6.250 1 26.47
Gels 10s/10m/30m:9 / 24 / 32 Lime: 3AVER SUB 8.070 3.000 1 1.98
API WL: 10.60 ES: ON-MAG DRILL COLLAR 7.880 2.940 1 30.56
HTHP WL: ECD: 8.70 3TRING STABILIZER 17.000 2.440 1 7.22
Cake API I HTHP: 2.0 / nl K: I
Solids I Sol Corr: 2.70 / 2.70 Carbonate. 3ROSSOVER 9.500 3.000 1 1.47

Oil I Water: I 97.3 Bicarbonate: 3HOCK SUB 9.130 2.880 1 9.84

Sand: 0.30 Form Loss: 79.0 / 330.0 3ROSSOVER 9.630 2.810 1 3.00

Water Added: Fluid Disch: I ]RILL COLLAR 8.000 3.000 1 122.13
Oil Added: 3ROSSOVER 6.630 3.000 1 2.80
LGS: 2.70 / 24.49 BWDP 5.000 2.625 4 123.06
VG Meter: 6@3 / 7@60 / 21@100 / 29 200 / 36@300 / 52@600
Comments: DRILLED FROM 2834 O 2839. THE SHOCK SUB Total Length: 1,054.00 ft Wt below Jars: 45,973.0 kip
TWISTED OFF AND LEFT 93.46 FT OF BHA IN THE HOLE. PULLED UU I
OF THE HOLE AND CURRENTLY MAKING UP FISHING TOOLS AT
REPORT TIME.

MUD PRC DUCTS

ENG 24 HR
#1Product Un1its Qty Used1.00 RECEIVED

ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00
NEW PHPA 5 GAL 1.00 NOV1 4 2008
NEWEASE 203 5 GAL/CN 2.00
TAX 1 1.00
WALNUT PLUG M 50 LB/SX 4.00 DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MINING

11/10/2008 2:34:49PM Page 1 of



OXY USA

DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAU VALLEY FEDERAL 35-1 Date: 11/07/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILL VERT USA Report No: 43

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 3:00 3.00 14SUDF TRIP WSHO PT TRIP OUT OF HOLE, FOUND BROKEN CONNECTION ON BOTTOM SUB OF SHOCK

SUB. BOTTOM 2 1/2' OF SHOCK SUB LEFT IN HOLE. LENGTH OF FISH 93', TOF@
2745'

3:00 6:00 3.00 14SUDF WAIT WOEQ PT WAIT ON FISHING HAND & FISHING TOOLS
6:00 10:30 4.50 14SUDF WAIT WOEQ PT CONTINUE TO WAIT ON FISHERMAN. ETA 14:00 HRS.

10:30 13:00 2.50 14SUDF OTHR PT WHILE WAITING, PICK-UP 6 8" DC'S. PLACE IN "MOUSE HOLE" AND TORQUE &
RACK BACK. TOTAL 8" IN DERRICK, 3 STDS. JSA PRIOR TO OPERATION.

13:00 15:00 2.00 14SUDF OTHR PT FISHING HAND ARRIVES @ 13:00 HRS. DISCUSS FISHING PLAN; CONTACT DRLG
ENGR AND ADVISE. OBTAIN APPROVAL FOR PLAN. TOOLS ARRIVE @14:00 HRS.
OFF-LOAD SAME.

15:00 19:30 4.50 14SUDF RIGMT REP PT "lRON ROUGHNECK" BLEW HOSE AND GUTTED MECHANICS WHILE MAKE-UP 8"
DC'S. R/U "OLD SCHOOL" TONGS AND SPINNERS AND COUNTER WElGHTS.
TOOL HAND MEASURING TOOLS.

19:30 0:00 4.50 14SUDF FISH DRLSTR PT START TO PICK-UP TOOLS & TIH TO FISH 9 1/8" OD; SHOCK SUB LOWER SUB,
BELOW SERVICE BREAK.

Total Time 24.00
Safety Inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 30.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 30.00 CLEAR; WIND 7 MPH EINE; AMBIENT TEMP 32 DEGREES; WIND CHILL 26
Incident Comments: UI-GREES

NO ACCIDENTSOR SPILLS REPORTED

Other Remarks: DIESEL USED: 1484 GALS. DIESEL ON HAND: 16,536 GALS.
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CONFIDENTIALIDAILY OPERATIONS ARTNER REPORT
) PLATEAUVALLEY FEDERAL 35-1 Date: 11/08/2008

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILL VERT USA Report No: 44

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB @7,920.00ft DFS: 8.19
Today's MD: 2,839.0 ft Progress: 0.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 2,839.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 0.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 0.0 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: TERTIARY@2,552.0 Lithology: BLACK CAP MOUNTAIN
Current Ops: WAIT ON CASING CREW
24-Hr Summary: RECOVER FISH / LOG HOLE
24-Hr Forecast: RUN & CEMENT 13 3/8" ( ASING

CASINGlWELL CONTROL HOOKLOAD & TORQUE HYDRAULICS MUD GAS Avg Max
Last Casing: 20.000in @1,135ft Str Wt UplDn: / Pump Rate: 0.0 Conn:
Next Casing: 13.375in @2,810ft Str Wt Rot: Pump Press: 0.0 Trip:
Last BOP Press Test: Torq Off Btm: Backgr:
Form Test/EMW: Torq On Btm:

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA (LAST 6)

Supervisor 1: DUB CAMERON MD Incl Azi TVD NI-S El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2: ROD MANIACI 2,631.0 0.06 349.56 2,631.00 1.8 -0.5 1.8 0.04 0.02
Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 2,536.0 0.04 313.11 2,536.00 1.7 -0.4 1.7 0.04 0.04
Geologist: KIRK SPARKMAN 2,443.0 0.00 12.15 2,443.00 1.7 -0.4 1.7 0.05 -0.05

Oxy Personnel: 0 2,347.0 0.05 13.52 2,347.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.01 0.01
Contractor Personnel: 25 2,252.0 0.04 13.73 2,252.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.06 -0.05

Total on Site: 25 2,156.0 0.09 42.2/ 2,156.00 1.5 -0.6 1.5 0.07 0.06

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
2 17.500 HUGHES CHRISTE GTX-C20 6068047 515 3x20 2,782.0 2,839.0 1-0-BT-M E-l-PN-TD

BIT OPERATING PARAMETERS TODAY
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

MUD DATA - NENPARK-AVA LAST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: ED MCDANIELINICK LIGHl MBT: 27.5 lbm/bb1 BHA No: 2 Bit No: 2 MD In: 2,782.0 ft
Sample From: PIT pH: 8.5 Purpose: DRILL VERTICAL SURFACE HOLE MD Out: 2,839.0 ft
Mud Type: LOW SOLIDS / NON-DISP Pm / Pom:
Time I MD: 21:00 / 2,839.0 Pf / Mf: 0.1 / 0.4 Component OD ID Jts Length

Density @ Temp: 8.70 / 67 Chlorides: 400 TRI-CONE BIT 17.500 3.750 1 1.32

Rheology Temp: 67 Ca+ I K+: / RSS (PUSH BIT) 9.500 3.200 1 14.02
Viscosity: 56.00 CaCl2: STRING STABILIZER 17.375 2.440 1 8.09
PV I YP: 26 / 18 Clom: VlWDTOOL 8.310 6.250 1 26.47
Gels 10s/10m/30m:7 / 20 / 32 Lime: SAVER SUB 8.070 3.000 1 1.98
API WL: 10.40 ES: MON-MAG DRILL COLLAR 7.880 2.940 1 30.56
HTHP WL: ECD: 8.70 STRING STABILIZER 17.000 2.440 1 7.22
Cake API I HTHP: 2.0 / n / K / 3ROSSOVER 9.500 3.000 1 1.47
Solids / Sol Corr: 2.70 / 2.70 Carbonate:
Oil / Water: / 97.3 Bicarbonate: SHOCK SUB 9.130 2.880 1 9.84

Sand: 0.20 Form Loss: 270.0 / 600.0 3ROSSOVER 9.630 2.810 1 3.00

Water Added: Fluid Disch: / JRILL COLLAR 8.000 3.000 1 122.13
Oil Added: 3ROSSOVER 6.630 3.000 1 2.80
LGS: 2.70 / 24.49 -lWDP 5.000 2.625 4 123.06
VG Meter: 5@3 / 6@6 / 18@100 / 26(ãs200 / 32@300 / 48@600
Comments: OVERSHOT RUN SUC JESSFULLY CAUGHTFISH. TOH Total Length: 1,054.00 ft Wt below Jars: 45,973.0 kip
TO RETRIEVE FISH; 100% RECOVERED. CIRCULATED MUD OVER
THE TOP OF THE HOLE THROUGHOUT THE DAY AND LOST 270 BBLS
@11.25 BBLS PER HOUR. CURRENTLY LOGGINGTHE HOLE.

MUDPRODUCTS RECEIVED
Product Units Qty Used

ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00 NOV1 4 2008
NEWEASE 203 5 GAL/CN 3.00
SAWDUST 2000 LBS/SK 15.00
TAX 1 1.00 MV.ûF01, GAS&MNNG
WALNUT PLUG M 50 LBISX 2.00

11/10/2008 2:33:37PM Page 1 of



OXYUSA
DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT

Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEY FEDERAL35-1 Date: 11/08/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 44

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 0:30 0.50 14SUEV FISH DRLSTR PT CONTINUE TRIPPING IN HOLE TO 1080'
0:30 2:30 2.00 14SUEV FISH DRLSTR PT TRIP BACK TO 300', PICK UP ACCELERATOR, RUN IN HOLE TO 1080'

2:30 4:00 1.50 14SUEV FISH DRLSTR PT TRIP IN HOLE TO TOF @ 2745'
4:00 6:00 2.00 14SUEV FISH DRLSTR PT TAG FISH, MOVE DOWN TO 10K, IST BUMP. INCREASE TO 30K, GOT 7" DOWN

TRAVEL, PICK-UP &GAINED 8K STRING WEIGHT, TRIP OUT OF HOLE WITH FISH
6:00 10:00 4.00 14SUEV TRIP BHA PT PULL TO TOP OF FISH. "GOT IT"

10:00 12:30 2.50 14SUEV TRIP BHA PT BREAK-OUT TOOLS FROM TOP OF FISH. BREAK-OUT RSS TOOLS, L/D BIT.
INSPECT TOOLS & BIT. RESULTS. BIT - JETS COMPLETELY PLUGGED W. HARD
LIMESTONE.

12:30 15:30 3.00 14SUEV WAIT WOEQ PT WAITINGON BAKER/ATLAS.ETA - 14:00 HRS.

15:30 18:00 2.50 14SUEV LOG RIGUP P BAKERIATLAS ON LOCATION. ORIENTATION AND BEGIN R/UP.

18:00 22:00 4.00 14SUEV LOG OHLOG P RUN WlRELINE LOGS. TAG BOTTOM @2828' MD. LOG UP 3 TIMES TO CASING
SHOE @ 1135'RKB. LOG WITH GR, HDLL, XM AC MONOPOLE CALIPER.

22:00 0:00 2.00 11STRC CSG RUNCSG PT WAIT ON CASING CREW

Total Time 24.00
Safety Inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 31.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 31.00 CLEAR; WIND 25 MPH S/SE; AMBIENT TEMP 39 DEGREES; WIND CHILL 28

Incident Comments: DEGREES

NO ACCIDENTS, NO SPILLS REPORTED

Other Remarks: BLM AL McKEE GIVEN 24 HR NOTICE FOR SURFACE CASINGAT 16:00 HRS DIRECT CONVERSATION
BLM BERT HEART GIVEN 24 HR NOTICE FOR SURFACE CASING AT 16:00 HRS BY VOICE MAIL
DIESEL USED: 1276 GALS. DIESEL ON HAND: 24172 GALS.
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CONFIDENTIALY OPERATIONS P T ER 30 HOUR REPORT
PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 11/09/2008

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILL VERT USA Report No: 45

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB @7,920.00ft DFS: 9.19
Today's MD: 2,839.0 ft Progress: 0.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 2,839.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 0.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 0.0 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: TERTIARY@2,552.0 L.ithology:
Current Ops: RUN 13 3/8" CASING
24-Hr Summary: WAIT ON IPS CASING CREWS, WAIT ON IPS TONGS / RUN CASING
24-Hr Forecast: RUN CASING / CEMENT NIPPLE DOWN

CASINGlWELL CONTROL HOOKLOAD & TORQUE HYDRAULICS MUD GAS Avg Max
Last Casing: 20.000in @1,135ft Str Wt UplDn: / Pump Rate: 0.0 Conn:
Next Casing: 13.375in @ 2,810ft Str Wt Rot: Pump Press: 0.0 Trip:
Last BOP Press Test: Torq Off Btm: Backgr:
Form Test/EMW: Torq On Btm:

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA (LAST 6)
Supervisor 1: DUB CAMERON MD Incl Azi TVD N/-S El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2: ROD MANIACI 2,631.0 0.06 349.56 2,631.00 1.8 -0.5 1.8 0.04 0.02
Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 2,636.0 0.04 313.11 2,536.00 1.7 -0.4 1.7 0.04 0.04
Geologist: KIRK SPARKMAN 2,443.0 0.00 12.15 2,443.00 1.7 -0.4 1.7 0.05 -0.05

Oxy Personnel: 0 2,347.0 0.05 13.52 2,347.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.01 0.01
Contractor Personnel: 25 2,252.0 0.04 13.73 2,252.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.06 -0.05

Total on Site: 25 2,156.0 0.09 42.2/ 2,156.00 1.5 -0.5 1.5 0.07 0.06

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
2 17.500 HUGHES CHRISTE GTX-C20 6068047 515 3x20 2,782.0 2,839.0 1-0-BT-M E-l-PN-TD

BIT OPERATING PARAMETERS TODAY
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

MUD DATA - NE NPARK-AVA LAST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: ED MCDANIEL/NICK LIGHl MBT: 27.5 lbm/bbl BHA No: 2 Bit No: 2 MD In: 2,782.0 ft
Sample From: PIT pH: 8.5 Purpose: DRILL VERTICAL SURFACE HOLE MD Out: 2,839.0 ft
Mud Type: LOW SOLIDS / NON-DISP Pm I Pom:
Time / MD: 21:00 / 2,839.0 Pf I Mf: 0.1 / 0.5 Component OD ID Jts Length

Density @Temp: 8.70 / 60 Chlorides: 400 TRI-CONE BIT 17.500 3.750 1 1.32
Rheology Temp: 60 Ca+ I K+: / RSS (PUSH BIT) 9.500 3.200 1 14.02
Viscosity: 55.00 CaCl2: 3TRING STABILIZER 17.375 2.440 1 8.09
PV I YP: 18 / 14 Clom: VlWDTOOL 8.310 6.250 1 26.47
Gels 10s/10m/30m:8 / 20 / 30 Lime: 3AVER SUB 8.070 3.000 1 1.98
API WL: 10.60 ES: MON-MAG DRILL COLLAR 7.880 2.940 1 30.56
HTHP WL: ECD: 8.70 STRING STABILIZER 17.000 2.440 1 7.22
Cake API I HTHP: 2.0 / nl K: / RÒSSOVER 9.500 3.000 1 1.47Solids / Sol Corr: 2.70 / 2.70 Carbonate:
Oil I Water: / 97.3 Bicarbonate: 3HOCK SUB 9.130 2.880 1 9.84

Sand: 0.20 Form Loss: I 600.0 3ROSSOVER 9.630 2.810 1 3.00
Water Added: Fluid Disch: I JRILL COLLAR 8.000 3.000 1 122.13
Oil Added: 3ROSSOVER 6.630 3.000 1 2.80
LGS: 2.70 / 24.49 BWDP 5.000 2.625 4 123.06
VG Meter: 5@3 / 6@6 / 18@100 / 25g200 / 32@300 / 50@600
Comments: COMPLETED WIRE-LINE LOGS AS PROGRAMMED, Total Length: 1,054.00 ft Wt below Jars: 45,973.0 kip
USING WESTERN ATLAS.

RIGGED UP AND BEGAN RUNNING 13.25 CASING;
WHEN MAKING UP 4TH JOINT, THE BUTTRESS THREADS WERE

MUD PRODUCTS
Product Units Qty Used222 00 i RECEIVED

NOV1 4 2008

DN.OFOLL,GAS&MINING
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OXY USA

DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER 30 HOUR REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEY FEDERAL 35-1 Date: 11/09/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 45

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 2:30 2.50 14SURC CSG RUNCSG PT WAIT ON CASlNG CREW
2:30 6:00 3.50 14SURC CSG RIGUP P RIG UP CASING EQUIPMENT
6:00 7:00 1.00 14SURC WAIT WOEQ PT NOTIFIED THAT TESCO DID NOT BRING 13 3/8" BACK-UP TONGS AS ORDERED.

CONTACTED THEM ON PUSHER'S PHONE AND THEY WILL HOT-SHOT. JSA FOR
RUNNING CSG.

7:00 12:00 5.00 14SURC WAIT WOEQ PT WAITING ON TESCO TONGS/ SEE REMARKS.
12:00 13:30 1.50 14SURC CSG RUNCSG P TONGS ARRIVE. MAKE-UP SHOE TRACK & TlH W/ SURFACE CSG. FILL EACH JT.

UNTIL I GET ENOUGH WEIGHTTO RUN A FEW.
13:30 15:30 2.00 14SURC CSG RUNCSG PT BACK-UP TONGS KEEP SLIPPING. GETTING DANGEROUS. SHUT DOWN

OPERATIONS AND ATTEMPT TO MODIFY TONGS W/ RIG TONG HEADS. MAKE-UP
JT.

15:30 16:30 1.00 14SURC CSG RUNCSG PT CROSS-THREAD JT. ATTEMPT TO BACK-OUT, FAILED. HEAT-UP COLLAR &
ATTEMPT TO BACK-OUT. FAILED. 3/4 OF THREADS MADE-UP. CONTACT DRLG
ENGR AND ADVISE.

16:30 19:00 2.50 14SURC CSG RUNCSG PT TALK W/ DRLGSUPT. WILL ATTEMPT TO BACK-OFF BOX AGAIN AND L/D JT.

19:00 20:30 1.50 14SURC CSG RUNCSG PT HEAT-UP AND BREAK-OUT COLLAR FROM JT ON RACK & INSTALL ON JT ON
SLIPS.

20:30 21:30 1.00 14SURC CSG RIGUP PT RIG UP CONVENTION TONGS, ORDERED FOR BACK-UP.

21:30 0:00 2.50 14SURC CSG RUNCSG P PICK UP FLOAT EQUIPMENT &TRIP IN CASING. CIRCULATE THROUGH FLOAT
EQUIPMENT.

Total Time 24.0C
( PERATIONS - NEXTDAY

From To Hrs Up Up Up Up Operation Details
Phase Code Sub Type

0:00 0:30 0.50 14SURC CSG RUNCSG P RUN 13 3/8" CASING TO 1070'.

0:30 1:30 1.00 14SURC CIRC CNDFLD P CIRCULATEMUD &CONDITION HOLE@5 BPM. NO DYMANICMUD LOSSES
NOTED.

1:30 3:00 1.50 14SURC CSG RUNCSG P CONTINUE RUNNING CASING TO 2030'

3:00 4:00 1.00 14SURC CSG RUNCSG P BREAK CIRCULATION @ 5 BPM. DYNAMICLOSSES 3 BPM, CONTINUE RUNNING
CASING TO 2732 UP WT= 205K, DN WT= 196K

4:00 5:00 1.00 14SURC CSG RIGUP PT WHILE FILLIINGPIPE 2 JOINTS FROM SHOE DEPTH, THE SYSTEM PRESSURED
UP. WORKED PIPE UP WT=244K, DN WT= 215K. HAVE 19% RETURNS WHILE
LOWERING STRING IN HOLE. PICKED UP TELECO TOOL, AND COULD NET SEE
MUD COMING OUT FROM THE BOTTOM. DECIDED TO RUN THE REMAINING 2
JOINTS AND TROUBLE SHOOT. BROKE OFF TELECO TOOL AND RIGGED AIR
HOSE TO TOP DRIVE. FOUND SLUSH IN TOP DRIVE. THAW OUT & MAKE TOP
DRIVE UP ON TELECO TOOL.

5:00 6:00 1.00 14SURC CIRC CNDHOL P CIRCULATE @ 3 BPM, STAGING UP IN 10 SPM INCRIMENTS TO 5 BPM WITH NO
NOTICABLE MUD LOSSES. RIGGING DOWN CASING EQUIPMENT, AND GETTING
HALIBURTON EQUIPMENT IN PLACE.

Total Time 6.00
Safety incidt nt? N Days since Last RI: 32.00 Weather Comments:

Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 32.00 CLEAR; WIND CALM; AMBIENT TEMP 26 DEGREES; WIND CHILL 26 DEGREES

Incident Comments:
NO ACCIDENTSOR SPILLS REPORTED
Other Remarks: TESCO SAID l DID NOT ORDER TONGS. REMEMBER CONVERSATION W/ BUD, COORDINATOR, ABOUT MAKING SURE I

HAD CORRECT TORQUE. NEEDED BACK-UP'S. PERHAPS I DIDN'T MAKE MYSELF CLEAR. TONGS NOT HERE, IT'S MY
FAULT.
DIESEL USED: 1060 GALS. DIESEL ON HAND: 14204 GALS.

11/10/2008 2:36:08PM Page 2 of
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OXY USA

CONFIDENTIALY OPERATIONS PARTNER 30 HOUR REPORT
PLATEAUVALLEY FEDERAL 35-1 Date: 11/10/2008

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILL VERT USA Report No: 46

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB@7,920.00ft DFS: 10.19
Today's MD: 2,839.0 ft Progress: 0.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 2,839.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 0.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 0.0 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: TERTIARY@2,552.0 Lithology:
Current Ops: WAIT ON CEMENT
24-Hr Summary: RUN CASING & CEMENT
24-Hr Forecast: WOC / NIPPLE DOWN / 5 IPPLE UP / TEST BOPE

CASINGlWELL CONTROL HOOKLOAD & TORQUE HYDRAULICS MUD GAS Avg Max
Last Casing: 20.000in @1,135ft Str Wt UplDn: I ump Rate: 0.0 Conn:
Next Casing: 13.375in @ 2,810ft Str Wt Rot: ump Press: 0.0 Trip:
Last BOP Press Test: 11/11/2008 Torq Off Btm: Backgr:
Form Test/EMW: Torq On Btm:

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA (LAST 6)
Supervisor 1: DUB CAMERON MD Incl Azi TVD NI-S El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2: ROD MANIACI 2,631.0 0.06 349.66 2,631.00 1.8 -0.5 1.8 0.04 0.02
Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 2,536.0 0.04 313.11 2,536.00 1.7 -0.4 1.7 0.04 0.04
Geologist: KIRK SPARKMAN 2,443.0 0.00 12.15 2,443.00 1.7 -0.4 1.7 0.04 -0.04

Oxy Personnel: 0 2,347.0 0.04 13.52 2,347.00 1.6 -0.4 1.7 0.00 0.00
Contractor Personnel: 26 2,252.0 0.04 13.73 2,252.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.06 -0.05

Total on Site: 26 2,166.0 0.09 42.27 2,156.00 1.5 -0.5 1.6 0.07 0.06

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No lADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code

BIT OPERATING PARAMETERS TODAY
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

MUD DiTA - LAST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: MBT:
Sample From: pH:
Mud Type: Pm I Pom: • \ l ·

Time I MD: 21:00 / 2,839.0 Pf / Mf: / Component | OD ID Jts Length

Density @ Temp: / Chlorides:
Rheology Temp: Ca+ I K+: /
Viscosity: CaCl2:
PV I YP: / Clom:
Gels 10s/10m/30m: I / Lime:
API WL: ES:
HTHP WL: ECD:
Cake API I HTHP: I n / K: I
Solids I Sol Corr: / Carbonate:
Oil / Water: / Bicarbonate:
Sand: Form Loss: / 600.0
Water Added: Fluid Disch: /
Oil Added:
LGS: /
VG Meter:
Comments: COMPLETED RUNNING 69#13.375 CASING TO 2809 FT
(SHOE DEPTH). CEMENTED SAME AT 2809 FEET W/ HALIBURTON;
TAKING RETURNS TO THE RESERVE PIT. 408 BBLS TOTAL
DISPLACEMENT, 208 BBLS CEMENT TO SURFACE.

MUD PRC DUCTS
Product Units Qty Used

22
2

.00 RECEIVED
NOV1 4 2008

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
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OXY USA

DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER 30 HOUR REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEY FEDERAL 35-1 Date: 11/10/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILL VERT USA Report No: 46

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 0:30 0.50 14SURC CSG RUNCSG P RUN 13 3/8" CASING TO 1070'.
0:30 1:30 1.00 14SURC CIRC CNDFLD P CIRCULATE MUD & CONDITION HOLE @ 5 BPM. NO DYMANIC MUD LOSSES

NOTED.
1:30 3:00 1.50 14SURC CSG RUNCSG P CONTINUE RUNNINGCASINGTO 2030'
3:00 4:00 1.00 14SURC CSG RUNCSG P BREAK CIRCULATION @ 5 BPM. DYNAMIC LOSSES 3 BPM, CONTINUE RUNNING

CASING TO 2732 UP WT= 205K, DN WT= 196K
4:00 5:00 1.00 14SURC CSG RIGUP P WHILE FILLliNG PIPE 2 JOINTS FROM SHOE DEPTH, THE SYSTEM PRESSURED

UP. WORKED PlPE UP WT=244K, DN WT= 215K. HAVE 19% RETURNS WHILE
LOWERING STRING IN HOLE. PICKED UP TELECO TOOL, AND COULD NET SEE
MUD COMING OUT FROM THE BOTTOM. DECIDED TO RUN THE REMAINING 2
JOINTS AND TROUBLE SHOOT. BROKE OFF TELECO TOOL AND RIGGED AIR
HOSE TO TOP DRIVE. FOUND SLUSH IN TOP DRIVE. THAW OUT & MAKE TOP
DRIVE UP ON TELECO TOOL.

5:00 6:00 1.00 14SURC CIRC CNDHOL P CIRCULATE @ 3 BPM, STAGING UP IN 10 SPM INCRIMENTS TO 5 BPM WITH NO
NOTICABLE MUD LOSSES. RIGGING DOWN CASING EQUIPMENT, AND GETTING
HALIBURTON EQUIPMENT IN PLACE.

6:00 10:00 4.00 14SURC CIRC CNDHOL P R/U HALLIBURTON - CONDUCT R/U SAFETY MEETING. SAFETY MEETINGFOR
CEMENT OPERATIONS. TEST PUMPS AND LINESTO

10:00 15:00 5.00 14SURC CMT PRIM P CEMENT SURFACE AS FOLLOWS: LEAD - 1,200 SKS VERSACEM; 12.3#lGAL; 2.34
YLD; 12.71 GAL/SK @ 5BBL/MIN. TAIL - 310 SKS VERSACEM; 12.8#lGAL' 2.08 YLD;
10.75 GALISK @5 BBL/MIN. DISPLACEMENT: 408 BBLS.@4BBLSIMIN. CEMENT
TO SURFACE - 208 BBLS. RECOVERED 200 BBLS CEMENT. BUMP PLUG @ 800
PSI. INCREASE TO 1,800 PSI. HELD FOR 5 MIN. OPEN BACK TO TANKS. BLED
BACK 1.5-2 BBLS. FLOATS HELD.

15:00 0:00 9.00 14SURC CMT WOC P WAIT ON CEMENT. OPEN 3" VALVESON 20" & DRAIN CEMENT. NO CEMENT
FALL-BACK

Total Time 24.0C

OPERATIONS - NEXT DAY
From To Hrs Up Up Up Up Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type

0:00 1:00 1.00 14SURC CMT WOC P WAIT ON CEMENT
1:00 4:30 3.50 14SURC CSG RIGUP P PREJOB SAFETY MEETING. RIG DOWN CEMENT HEAD, PICK UP RISER, ROUGH

CUT 13 3/8" CASING, RIG DOWN RISER & CASING CUT OFF JOINT
4:30 6:00 1.50 14SURC WLHD RWH P MAKE FINAL CUT ON CASING, & INSTALL WELL HEAD EQUIPMENT

Total Time 6.00
Safety Incident? N Days since Last RI: 33.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 33.00 MOSTLY CLOUDY; WIND 2 MPH WINW; AMBIENT TEMP 27 DEGREES; WIND CHILL

Incident Comments: 2/ UEUREES

NO ACCIDENTS OR SPILLS REPORTED.

Other Remarks: DIESEL USED: 1272 GALS. DIESEL ON HAND: 17172 GALS.
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OXY USA

CONFIDENTIAL.Y OPERATIONS PARTNER 30 HOUR REPORT
, PLATEAU VALLEY FEDERAL 35-1 Date: 11/11/2008

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILL VERT USA Report No: 47

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB @7,920.00ft DFS: 11.19
Today's MD: 2,839.0 ft Progress: 0.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 2,839.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 0.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 0.0 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: TERTIARY@2,552.0 Lithology:
Current Ops: TEST BOPE
24-Hr Summary: WOC / NIPPLE DOWN RISER & CUT OFF CASING LANDING JOINT / INSTALL WELL HEAD & BOPE EQUIPMENT
24-Hr Forecast: TEST BOPE / PICK UP Bi IA # 3 / RUN TO FC / DISP TO BRINE / TEST CSG / DRILL OUT + 20 FT / FIT / DRILL AHEAD

CASINGlWELL CONTROL HOOKLOAD & TORQUE HYDRAULICS MUD GAS Avq Max
Last Casing: 20.000in @ 1,135ft Str Wt UplDn: / Pump Rate: 0.0 Conn:
Next Casing: 13.375in @ 2,810ft Str Wt Rot: Pump Press: 0.0 Trip:
Last BOP Press Test: 11/12/2008 Torq Off Btm: Backgr:
Form Test/EMW: Torq On Btm:

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA (LAST 6)

Supervisor 1: DUB CAMERON/WADE FRAME MD Incl Azi TVD N/-S El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2: ROD MANIACl Ž,631.0 0.06 349.56 2,631.00 1.8 -0.5 1.8 0.04 0.02
Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 2,536.0 0.04 313.11 2,536.00 1.7 -0.4 1.7 0.04 0.04
Geologist: KIRK SPARKMAN 2,443.0 0.00 12.15 2,443.00 1.7 -0.4 1.7 0.04 -0.04

Oxy Personnel: 0 2,347.0 0.04 13.52 2,347.00 1.6 -0.4 1.7 0.00 0.00
Contractor Personnel: 25 2,252.0 0.04 13.73 2,252.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.06 -0.05

Total on Site: 25 2,156.0 0.09 42.27 2,156.00 1.6 -0.5 1.6 0.07 0.06

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code

BIT OPERATING PARAMETERSTODAY
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

MUD DI TA - LAST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: MBT:
Sample From: pH:
TMumde

M : 21:00 / 2,839.0
LmIM m: Component OD ID Jts Length

Density @Temp: / Chlorides:
Rheology Temp: Ca+ / K+: I
Viscosity: CaCl2:
PV I YP: / Clom:
Geis 10s/10m/30m: / / Lime:
API WL: ES:
HTHP WL: ECD:
Cake API I HTHP: I nl K: /
Solids I Sol Corr: / Carbonate:
Oil I Water: / Bicarbonate:
Sand: Form Loss: 0.0 / 600.0
Water Added: Fluid Disch: /
Oil Added:
LGS: /
VG Meter:
Comments: COMPLETED RIGGING-UP "2" 400 BBL UP-RIGHTS FOR
RECEIVING BRINE. RECEIVING BRINE AND COMPLETING CLEANING
OF MUD TANKSAT REPORT TIME.

WORKINGON NIUBOPs AND TESTING SAME AT
MUD PRC DUCTS

Product Units Qty Used
ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENG 24 HR#2 1 1.00 RECEIVED
SAWDUST 2000 LBS/SK 45.00
TAX 1 1.00 NOV1 4 2008

I
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

I
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OXY USA

DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER 30 HOUR REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 11/11/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 47

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 1:00 1.00 14SURC CMT WOC P WAIT ON CEMENT
1:00 4:30 3.50 14SURC CSG RIGUP P PREJOB SAFETY MEETING. RIG DOWN CEMENT HEAD, PICK UP RISER, ROUGH

CUT 13 3/8" CASING, RIG DOWN RISER & CASING CUT OFF JOINT
4:30 6:00 1.50 14SURC WLHD RWH P MAKE FINAL CUT ON CASING, & INSTALL WELL HEAD EQUIPMENT. TORQUE

WRENCHES &BOP TESTORS ON LOCATION - 06:00 HRS.
6:00 10:30 4.50 14SURC WLHD RWH P CONTINUE TO WELD-ON "A" SECTION &TEST SAME TO 1,000 PSI. TRUCK FROM

TUBULAR TRANS. ON LOCATION. LOADED-UP 13 JTS & CUT-OFF, (595.40'-
THREADS-ON) 13 3/8" J-55 BTC CSG. & RETURNED TO YARD. 09:00 HRS.

10:30 12:00 1.50 14SURC WLHD RWH P INSTALL "B" SECTION USING TORQUE WRENCHES. NOTIFIED STATE, (AL
MCGEE & BERT HART), WILL TEST BOP'S ON 11/12/08, 11:00 HRS. NOTIFICATION
TIME: 10:30 HRS, 11/12/08.

12:00 0:00 12.00 14SURC BOP RUBOP P NIPPLE UP BOPE. TORQUE STUDS WITH DOUBLEJACK, RIG UP KOOMEY LINES.

Total Time 24.00
OPERATIONSI - NEXT DAY

From To Hrs Up Up Up Up Operation Details
Phase Code Sub Type

0:00 6:00 6.00 14SURC BOP TSTBOP P PICK UP ROTATING HEAD RISER & FIT FLOW LINE, LAY DOWN SAME. FUNCTION
TEST RAMS&ANNULAR. INSTALL FINISHED ROTATINGHEAD ASSEMBLY.

Total Time 6.00
Safety Incident? N Days since Last RI: 34.00 Weather Comments:

Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 34.00
Incident Comments:
No incidents reported last 24 hours. 2 Safe work permits
issued.
Other Remarks: DIESEL USED: 1060 GALS. DIESEL ON HAND: 16112 GALS. RECD 0.

NO ACCIDENTS, NO SPILLS.

THIRD PARTY PERSONALSIGNED IN = 20

11/12/2008 8:04:13AM Page 2 of



CONFIDENTIAL/ OPERATIONS P T ER 30 HOUR REPORT
PLATEAU VALLEY FEDERAL 35-1 Date: 11/12/2008

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILL VERT USA Report No: 48

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB @7,920.00ft DFS: 12.19
Today's MD: 2,839.0 ft Progress: 0.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 2,839.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 0.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 0.0 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: TERTIARY@2,552.0 Lithology:
Current Ops: LAY DOWN 6 1/2" STEEL DRILL COLLARS
24-Hr Summary: RIG UP &TEST BOPE / LAY DOWN DRILL COLLARS
24-Hr Forecast: REPLACE HCR VALVE / FINISH BOPE TEST / PICK UP BHA #3 / DRILL OUT CEMENT / FIT / DRILL AHEAD

CASINGlWELL CONTROL HOOKLOAD & TORQUE HYDRAULICS MUD GAS Avg Max
Last Casing: 13.375in @2,810ft Str Wt UplDn: / Pump Rate: 0.0 Conn:
Next Casing: 9.625in @ 9,000ft Str Wt Rot: Pump Press: 0.0 Trip:
Last BOP Press Test: 11/12/2008 Torq Off Btm: Backgr:
Form Test/EMW: Torq On Btm:

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA (LAST 6)
Supervisor 1: WADE FRAME MD Incl Azi TVD N/-S El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2: ROD MANIACI 2,631.0 0.06 349.56 2,631.00 1.8 -0.5 1.8 0.04 0.02
Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 2,536.0 0.04 313.11 2,536.00 1.7 -0.4 1.7 0.04 0.04
Geologist: KIRK SPARKMAN 2,443.0 0.00 12.15 2,443.00 1.7 -0.4 1.7 0.04 -0.04

Oxy Personnel: 0 2,347.0 0.04 13.52 2,347.00 1.6 -0.4 1.7 0.00 0.00
Contractor Personnel: 25 2,252.0 0.04 13.73 2,252.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.06 -0.05

Total on Site: 25 2,156.0 0.09 42.27 2,156.00 1.5 -0.6 1.6 0.01 0.06

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code

BIT OPERATING PARAMETERS TODAY
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Nor Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

MUD DATA - NENPARK-AVA LAST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: Ed McDaniel MBT: 0.0 lbm/bbi
Sample From: OTHER pH: 7.0
Mud Type: BRINE / POLYMER WBM Pm / Pom: I i

Time / MD: 0:01 / 2,839.0 Pf I Mf: 0.0 / 0.1 Component OD ID Jts Length

Density @ Temp: / 52 Chlorides: 188,000
Rheology Temp: 70 Ca+ / K+: /
Viscosity: 27.00 CaCl2:
PV I YP: 3 / 0 Clom:
Gels 10s/10m/30m:1 / 1 / 1 Lime:
API WL: 100.00 ES:
HTHP WL: ECD:
Cake API I HTHP: .1 / nl K: /
Solids I Sol Corr: 0.20 / 0.20 Carbonate:
Oil I Water: / 99.7 Bicarbonate:
Sand: Form Loss: 0.0 / 600.0
Water Added: Fluid Disch: / 0.00
Oil Added:
LGS: 0.20 / 0.20
VG Meter: 1@100 / 1@200 / 3@300 / G@600
Comments: Insure that the reserve brine tanks are circulated
continiously to prevent settling. Keep the transfer pump fueled and running
at all times. Mud engineer has the keys for the locked transfer valves.

MUD PRC DUCTS
Product Units Qty Used

ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENG24HR#2 1 1.00 RECEIVED

NOV1 4 2008
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINlNG
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OXY USA

DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER 30 HOUR REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAU VALLEY FEDERAL 35-1 Date: 11/12/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILL VERT USA Report No: 48

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 6:00 6.00 14SURC BOP TSTBOP P PICK UP ROTATING HEAD RISER & FIT FLOW LINE, LAY DOWN SAME. FUNCTION

TEST RAMS & ANNULAR. INSTALL FINISHED ROTATINGHEAD ASSEMBLY.
6:00 10:30 4.50 14SURC BOP TSTBOP P RUN TEST PLUG, SEALS LEAKED, DRESS TEST PLUG.

10:30 18:00 7.50 14SURC BOP TSTBOP P TEST BOPE 250/5000 PSI. ANNULAR 250/3500 PSI. AND ASSOCIATED VLAVES,
HCR VALVE FAILED TEST. WITNESS OF BOP TEST WAVIED BY BERT HART WITH
BLM.

18:00 20:00 2.00 14SURC BOP RD BOP PT REMOVE HCR VALVE
20:00 21:00 1.00 14SURC BOP RDBOP PT RIG DOWN BOPE TEST EQUIPMENT
21:00 0:00 3.00 14SURC TRIP BHA P LAY DOWN 6 1/4" STEEL DRILL COLLARS IN DERRICK.

Total Time 24.00

OPERATIONS - NEXT DAY
From To Hrs Up Up Up Up Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type

0:00 1:30 1.50 14SURC BOP CHRAMS PT REPLACE HCR VALVE ON BOPE
1:30 6:00 4.50 14SURC BOP TSTBOP P TEST HCR & CHOKE 250/5000 PSI

Total Time 6.00
Safety incident? N Days since Last RI: 35.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 35.00 CLEAR; WIND 10 MPH SOUTH; AMBIENT TEMP 37 DEGREES; WIND CHILL 30

Incident Comments:

Other Remarks: DIESEL USED: 1060 GALS. DIESEL ON HAND: 15020 GALS. RECD 0.

NO ACCIDENTS, NO SPILLS.

THIRD PARTY PERSONALSIGNED IN = 5

11/13/2008 8:17:28AM Page 2 of



CONFIDENTIALlAILYOPERATIONS7ARTNER REPORT
PLATEAUVALLEY FEDERAL35-1 Date: 11/13/2008

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILL VERT
'

USA Report No: 49

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB @7,920.00ft DFS: 13.19
Today's MD: 2,839.0 ft Progress: 0.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 2,839.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 0.00 hr AFE MD/Days: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 0.0 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: TERTIARY@2,552.0 Lithology:
Current Ops: DRILL OUT CEMENT & FLOAT EQUIPMENT
24-Hr Summary: REPLACE HCR / FINISH TEST BOPE / PICK UP BHA #4 / TRIP IN & DRILL CEMENT
24-Hr Forecast: DRILL CEMENT / FIT / Di ILL AHEAD

CASINGlWELL CONTROL HOOKLOAD & TORQUE HYDRAULICS MUD GAS Avg Max
Last Casing: 13.375in @ 2,809ft Str Wt UplDn: 205.0/ 195.0 kip Pump Rate: 0.0 Conn:
Next Casing: 9.625in @ 9,000ft Str Wt Rot: 200.0 kip Pump Press: 0.0 Trip:
Last BOP Press Test: 11/12/2008 Torq Off Btm: 1,500.0 ft-1bf Backgr:
Form Test/EMW: Torq On Btm: 2,000.0 ft-Ibf

PERSONNEL SURVEYDATA(LAST6)

Supervisor 1: WADE FRAME MD Incl Azi TVD NI-S El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2: ROD MANIACI 2,631.0 0.06 349.56 2,631.00 1.8 -0.5 1.8 0.04 0.02
Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 2,536.0 0.04 313.11 2,536.00 1.7 -0.4 1.7 0.04 0.04
Geologist: KIRK SPARKMAN 2,443.0 0.00 12.16 2,443.00 1.7 -0.4 1.7 0.04 -0.04

Oxy Personnel: 0 2,347.0 0.04 13.52 2,347.00 1.6 -0.4 1.7 0.00 0.00
Contractor Personnel: 25 2,252.0 0.04 13.73 2,252.00 1.6 -0.4 1.6 0.06 -0.05

Total on Site: 25 2,156.0 0.09 42.27 2,156.00 1.5 -0.5 1.6 0.01 0.06

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
3 12.250 BAKER HCD505ZX 7015752 323 7x13 2,839.0

BIT OPERATING PARAMETERS TODAY
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max
3 0.00 0.00 0.C 0.0 0.0 0.0 5.0/12.0 30/70 0.907 486.3 233.4 1.6

MUD DATA - NENPARK-AVA LAST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: Ed McDaniels/ Jason Moore MBT: 0.0 lbm/bbi BHA No: 3 Bit No: 3 MD In: 2,839.0 ft
Sample From: IN pH: 7.0 Purpose: MD Out:
Mud Type: BRINE / POLYMER WBM Pm / Pom:
Time / MD: 0:01 / 2,839.0 Pf I Mf: 0.0 / 0.1 Component OD ID Jts Length

Density @Temp: 9.98 / 55 Chlorides: 180,000 3DC BIT 12.250 1 1.34

Rheology Temp: 70 Ca+ I K+: / ROTARY STEERABLE MOTOR 12.250 3.200 1 13.86
Viscosity: 27.00 CaCl2: NON-MAG INTEGRAL BLADE STABILl2 12.130 2.810 1 6.40
PV I YP: 3 / 0 Clom: SAVERSUB 8.250 2.880 1 3.39
Gels 10s/10m/30m:1 / 1 / 1 Lime: VlWDTOOL 8.250 6.250 1 24.24
API WL: 100.00 ES: VIWDTOOL 8.500 3.000 1 3.25
HTHP WL: ECD: MON-MAG DRILL COLLAR 8.000 2.380 1 30.28
Cake API / HTHP 5 / n / K I ON-MAG INTEGRAL BLADE STABILl2 12.130 2.880 1 6.74
Solids / Sol Corr: 0.10 / 0.10 Carbonate:
Oil I Water: I 99.9 Bicarbonate: 3PIRAL DRILL COLLAR 7.880 3.000 2 60.60

Sand: Form Loss: 0.0 / 600.0 3HOCK SUB 8.130 1.180 1 12.04
Water Added: Fluid Disch: / 3PIRAL DRILL COLLAR 7.630 2.880 7 210.63
Oil Added: 3ROSSOVER 7.940 3.000 1 2.80
LGS: 0.10 / 0.10 iWDP 5.000 3.000 4 123.06
VG Meter: 1@3 / 1@6 / 1@100 / 1@200 / 3@300 / 6@600
Comments: HOLE LOSSES SHOWNAS 140 BBLS, IS FROM Total Length: 1,200.20 ft Wt below Jars: 62,873.0 kip
RE-CALIBRATION OF PASON VOLUME THIS MORNING. DISPLACED
380 BBLS HOLE VOLUME, PLUS CLEAN-UP VOLUME TO 10 PPG
BRINE. (555 BBLS). PERFORMING CASINGTEST PRIOR TO DRILLING

MUD PRC DUCTS
Product Units Qty Used

ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENG24HR#2 1 1.00 RECEIVED
PALLETS EA. 18.00
SAHXRINKWRAP E1A. 18 00 NOV1 4 2008
TRUCKING SERVICE EACH 1.00

Olv.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

11/14/2008 11:32:32AM Page 1 of



OXY USA

DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAU VALLEY FEDERAL 35-1 Date: 11/13/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILL VERT USA Report No: 49

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 1:30 1.50 14SURC BOP CHRAMS PT REPLACE HCR VALVE ON BOPE
1:30 6:00 4.50 14SURC BOP TSTBOP P TEST HCR & CHOKE 250/5000 PSI
6:00 6:30 0.50 14SURC RIGMT SRVRIG P SERVICE TOP DRIVE AND CHANGE OUT BRAKE FLUID CANISTER ON TOP DRIVE
6:30 9:00 2.50 14SURC SRFEQ RIGUP P INSTALL WEAR BUSHING AND RUN IN 2 LOCK DOWN PINS ON "B" SECTION.
9:00 14:00 5.00 14SURC TRIP BHA P PICK UP BHA CONSISTING OF HCD505ZX 12.25" BIT, POWERV RSS, STABILIZER,

SAVER SUB, POWER PULSE MVC, DOWN HOLE FILTER SUB, (1) 8" NMDC,
STABILIZER,(2) 8" STEEL DC, 8" SHOCK SUB, (7) 8" STEEL DC, X-O, (4) HWDP,
JAR, (22) HWDP = 1200.20'

LAID DOWN (1) STEEL DRILL COLLAR, DUE SLIP UPSET ON ONE SIDE ON DRILL
COLLAR WAS FOUND TO BE SMOOTH, POSSIBLY A MACHININGERROR.

14:00 15:00 1.00 14SURC TRIP DRILL P RUN IN THE HOLE TO 2339'.
15:00 16:30 1.50 14SURC TRIP DRILL P INSTALL ROTATING RUBBER.
16:30 17:00 0.50 14SURC TRIP DRILL P RUN IN THE HOLE FROM 2339' TO 2705'. TAG CEMENT AT 2705'. LANDING

COLLAR AT 2719'.
17:00 19:00 2.00 14SURC CIRC CHOVR P DISPLACE WELL WITH 10 PPG BRINE MUD
19:00 20:00 1.00 14SURC CSG PIPE P PRESSURE TEST CASING 250/1500 PSI
20:00 0:00 4.00 14SURC DRLOUT DOCMT P DRILL OUT CEMENT & FLOAT EQUIPMENT FROM 2705' TO 2723'.

UP WT= 205K DN WT= 195K RT WT= 200K; TQ OFF= 1K TQ ON= 2K; 670 GPM=
1425 PSI
8G LEVEL 1 SHOCKS WHILE DRILLINGCEMENT.

Total Eime 24.0C
Safety Inciden ? Y Days since Last RI: 36.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 36.00 CLEAR; WIND 10 MPH NINE; AMBIENT TEMP 30 DEGREES; WIND CHILL 21

Incident Comments:
MOTOR MAN ON DAY CREW SLIPPED ON THE SLICK
SURFACE IN THE OIL BUNKER CONTAINMENT AREA. IP
STATED THAT HIS LEFT KNEE WAS SORE AND TENDER
BUT WAS CAPABLE OF WALKINGON IT WITH NO
PROBLEMS AND DID NOT WISH TO SEEK MEDICAL
ASSISTANCE.
Other Remarks: DIESEL USED: 1696 GALS. DIESEL ON HAND: 13356 GALS. RECD 0.

NO ACCIDENTS, NO SPILLS.

THIRD PARTY PERSONAL SIGNED IN = 5

MOTOR MAN ON DAY LIGHT CREW WAS OBTAINING HYDRAULIC OIL FROM OIL BUNKER AND SLIPPED ON THE SLICK
SURFACE IN THE CONTAINMENT AREA. IP STATED THAT HIS LEFT KNEE WAS SORE AND TENDER BUT WAS CAPABLE
OF WALKING ON IT WITH NO PROBLEMS AND DID NOT WISH TO SEEK OR RECEIVE MEDICAL ASSISTANCE. IP WAS
WORKING HIS LAST HOUR OF A 14 DAY HITCH.
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CONFilENTIAL
From: <Blair_Rollins@oxy.com>
To: <caroldaniels@utah.gov>

Date: 11/14/2008 2:56 PM
Subject: Plateau ValleyFed 35-1 Morning Reports
Attachments: Nabors 797 - PVF 35-1 - Rpt 43 Partner.pdf; Nabors 797 - PVF 35-1 - Rpt 44

Partner.pdf; Nabors 797 - PVF 35-1 - Rpt 45 Partner.pdf; Nabors 797 - PVF 3
5-1 - Rpt 46 Partner.pdf; Nabors 797 - PVF 35-1 - Rpt 47 Partner.pdf; Nabor
s 797 - PVF 35-1 - Rpt 48 Partner.pdf; Nabors 797 - PVF 35-1 - Rpt 49 Partn
er.pdf

CC: <Rusty_Hanna@oxy.com>

Carol,

Please find attached the drilling reports from 11/7/08 - 11/13/08 for the Plateau Valley Federal 35-1 well. If
you have any questions or comments please feel free to contact me. Thank you and have a good
weekend.

Thank you,

Blair Rollins
2754 Compass Drive, Suite 170
Grand Junction, CO 81506
Office (970) 263-3629
Cell (970) 361-8655

RECEIVED
NOV1 4 2008

0 OF0iLGAS&



OXYUSA

CONFIDENTIALAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: 11/14/2008

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILL VERT USA Report No: 50

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB @7,920.00ft DFS: 14.19
Today's MD: 3,350.0 ft Progress: 511.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 2,839.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 19.50 hr AFE MD/Days: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 26.2 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: TERTIARY@2,552.0 Lithology: TERTIARY: TOP FLAGSTAFF FM 3302'
Current Ops: DRILLING AHEAD
24-Hr Summary: CONTINUED DRILL OUT OF SHOE TRACK I CONDUCT FIT EMW 13 PPG / DRILL AHEAD
24-Hr Forecast: DRILL AHEAD

CASINGlWELLCONTROL HOOKLOAD &TOROUE HYDRAULICS MUDGAS Av Max
Last Casing: 13.375in @2,809ft Str Wt UplDn: 220.0/ 190.0 kip Pump Rate: 828.4 Conn:
Next Casing: 9.625in @9,000ft Str Wt Rot: 205.0 kip Pump Press: 2,550.0 Trip:
Last BOP Press Test: 11/12/2008 Torq Off Btm: 2,500.0 ft-Ibt Backgr:
Form Test/EMW: FIT / 13.03 ppg Torq On Btm: 4,000.0 ft-lbf

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA(LAST.6)
Supervisor 1: WADE FRAME MD incl Azi TVD NI-S El-W VS DLS BuitcI
Supervisor 2: ROD MANIACI 3,440.0 0.18 165.4Ì 3,440.00 0.9 -1.3 1.1 0.33 -0.11

Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 3,344.0 0.29 246.21 3,344.00 1.1 -1.1 1.3 0.18 0.18
Geolocgist: KIRK SPARKMAN 3,249.0 0.12 236.30 3,249.00 1.3 -0.8 1.4 0.13 0.03
Oxy Personnel: 0 ,1 5.0 0.09 166.9 3, 5.00 .4

-0. 1. O. 0.00
Contractor Personnel: 25 3,06 .0 0.0 265. 0 3, 61.00 .5

-0.

.6 0. 8 0.00
Total on Site: 25

. . .

-

. . 4 -

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out 1-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
3 12.250 BAKER HCD505ZX 7015752 323 7x13 2,839.0

| |
BIT ÒPERATING PAllAMETERS TODAY

Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI
Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

3 19.50 19.50 511. 511.0 26. 26. 10.0/12.0 60/100 0.907 793. 296.3 3.3

MUDDATA - NENPARK-AVA LAST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: Ed McDaniel / Jason Moore MBT: 0.0 lbm/bbi BHA No: 3 Bit No: 3 MD In: 2,839.0 ft
Sample From: OUT pH: 9.0 Purpose: MD Out:
Mud Type: BRINE / POLYMER WBM Pm I Pom: Com onent OD ID Jts Len thTime / MD: 0:01 / 3,275.0 Pf I Mf: 0.1 / 0.3
Density @Temp: 10.10 / 81 Chlorides: 145,000 DC BIT 12.250 1 1.34
Rheology Temp: 70 Ca+ / K+: I 10TARY STEERABLE MOTOR 12.250 3.200 1 13.86
Viscosity: 40.00 CaC12: MON-MAG INTEGRAL BLADE STABILl2 12.130 2.810 1 6.40
PV I YP: 8 / 7 Clom: 3AVER SUB 8.250 2.880 1 3.39
Gels 10s/10m/30m:1 / 3 / 4 Lime: VlWDTOOL 8.250 6.250 1 24.24
API WL: 28.00 ES: VlWDTOOL 8.500 3.000 1 3.25
HTHP WL: ECD: 10.30 NON-MAG DRILL COLLAR 8.000 2.380 1 30.28
Cake API I HTHP: 2.0 / nl K: / NON-MAG INTEGRAL BLADE STABILl2 12.130 2.880 1 6.74Solids / Sol Corr: 3.70 / 3.70 Carbonate:
Oil / Water: I 96.3 Bicarbonate: 3PIRAL DRILL COLLAR 7.880 3.000 2 60.60
Sand: Form Loss: 0.0 / 600.0 3HOCK SUB 8.130 1.180 1 12.04
Water Added: Fluid Disch: / 3PIRAL DRILL COLLAR 7.630 2.880 7 210.63
Oil Added: 3ROSSOVER 7.940 3.000 1 2.80
LGS: 3.70 / 33.60 lWDP 5.000 3.000 4 123.06

T Total Length: 1,200.20 ft Wt below Jars: 62,873.0 kip
AND20" OF NEW HOLE. PERFORMED FIT TO 13 PPG EQUIVALENT,
AND RESUMED DRILLING NEW FORMATION W/ BRINE. BEGAN INITIAL
MUD-UP W/ DRILLING AHEAD. DILUTING BRINE BACK WITH FRESH

MUD PRC DUCTS
Product Units Qty Used gy

AQUA BLOC 50 LBS/SK 70.00 i V

CAUSTIC SODA 50 LB/SX 5.00
DEFOAM X 5 GAL/CN 4.00 NOV2 1 2008
DIALD 25 5 GAL/CN 6.00
ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00 r A3 & gg
FLOW-ZAN 25 LB SX 6.00
NEW GEL HY 50 LBS/SK 18.00
NEW PHPA 5 GAL 1.00
SALTGEL 50 LB/SX 265.00
SAWDUST 2000 LBS/SK 15.00
SEA MUD 50 LBS/SK 100.00
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OXYUSA

DAILYOPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: 11/14/2008
Prim. Reasor:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 50

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 1:00 1.00 14SURC DRLÖUT DOCMT P DRILLCEMENT FROM 2723' TO CSG SHOE@ 2809'. CLEAN ÖUT RAT HOLE TO

2839'
1:00 2:00 1.00 21INDR DRILL RSS P DRILL 12 1/4" HÖLE FROM 2839' TO 2859' UP WT= 205K; DN WT= 195K; RT WT=

200K; RPM* 110; TQ= 2/3; GPM 800= 1975 PSI.
BOTTOMSUP SAMPLE SHOWED TUFFS WITH SOME CALCITE.

2:00 3:00 1.00 21\NDR CIRC CHOVR P CIRCULATEHOLECLEAN 10 PPG SALTWATER.
3:00 4:30 1.50 21INDR DRLOUT DOCMT P TEST SURFACE LINES TO 1500 PSI / CONDUCT FIT OMW 10PPG PRESSURE UP

450 PSI, FOR AN EMW OF 13 PPG.

BERT HART WITH THE BLMWAIVED THE WITNESS OF THE FIT.
4:30 6:00 1.50 21INDR DRILL RSS P DRILLFROM 2859' TO 2860'

DN WT= 195K; RT WT= 200K; RPM = 90; TQ=2/3; GPM 800= 1975 PSI. LOWERED
ROTARY FROM 110 TO 90 RPM TO LOWER SHOCKS.
12G LEVEL 1 SHOCKS WHILE DRILLING.

6:00 13:30 7.50 21INDR DRILL RSS P DRILL
Ï¯ROM 2860' TO 3100'

UP WT*220K; DN WT= 190K; RT WT 205K; WOB= 10K; RPM= 100; TQ*4; GPM
838= 2350 PSI.

13:30 14:00 0.50 21|NDR RIGMT REP P SERVICE TOP DRIVE
14:00 17:00 3.00 21INDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 3100' TO 3205'.'

UP WT= 220K; DN WT= 190K; RT WT= 205K; WOB= 10K; RPM= 100; TQ= 4; GPM
838 2350 PSI.

17:00 17:30 0.50 21\NDR RIGMT REP PT REPAIR MUD PUMPS. TIGHTEN BELTS ON #3, & REPLACE CAP SEAL ON #2
PUMP.

17:30 0:00 6.50 21INDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 3205' TÒ3350'.'
UP WT*220K; DNWT= 190K; RT WT= 205K; WOB= 10K; RPM= 100; TQ= 4; GPM
838= 2350 PSI.

NOTE: AT 3293' ENCOUNTERED LOSSES OF 15 BBL/HR.
Total Time 24.0C

Safety Inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 37.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 37.00 CLEAR; WIND 15 MPH NE; AMBIENT TEMP 30 DEGREES; WIND CHILL 19 DEGREES
Incident Comments:
No incidents reported last 24 hours.

Other Remarks: DIESEL USED: 3,180 GALS. DIESEL ON HAND: 10,176 GALS. RECD 0.

NO ACCIDENTS, NO SPILLS.

THIRD PARTY PERSONAL SIGNED IN = 5
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OXYUSA

CONFIDENTIALoxi o anoaanen anon
LATEAUVÅLLEYFEDERAL35ef Date 11/15/2008

Prim Reason:ORfG DRILL VERT USA Repórt No 51

Welfhore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB @7,92000ft DFS 15 19
Today's MD: 3,967.0 ft Progress: 617.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 3,350.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 23.50 hr AFE MD/Days: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 26 3 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: TERTIARY 2 552 0 Lithology: TERTIARY: TOP FLAGSTAFF FM 3302'
Cunent Ops DRILL i 1/4" HOLE WI RSS
24-Hr Summary: DRILL12-1/4" HOLE WI RSS
24Hr Forecast: DRILL 12-1/4" ÑOLE W/ F SS

CASINGlWELLCONTROL HOOKLOAD& TORQUE BYORAULICS MUD GAS Av Max
Last Casing: 13.375in @2,809ft Str Wt UplDn: 222.0/ 220.0 kip Pump Rate: 795.4 Conn:
Next Casing: 9.625in @9,000ft Str Wt Rot: 220.01]P Rump Press: 2,550 0 Trip:
Last BOP Press Test: 11/12/2008 Torq Öff Btm 2,500 0 ff-Ibf Backgt:
ForniTest/EMW: FIT / 13 03 ppg Torq On Btm: 3,000 0 ft-Ibf

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA LAS 6)
Supervisor T: WADE FRAME NID inci Azi TVD NÍ-S El-W VS 011 Build
Supervisor 2 ROD MANIACI 4,006 0 0 25 347 8 4,005.99 1 2 -0 8 1:4 0.17 0.17
Tngineer: RUSTY HANNA 3 911 0 0 09 335.73 3,910.99 1 0 -0 7 1.1 0.19 -0.03

Geologist: KIRKSPARKMAN 3,817 0 0 12 95 31 3,816.99 0.9 -0 8 1.1 0.18 -0.04

Oxy Personnel; O 3,723 0 0 16 22 22 3,722.99 0.8 -1 0 1.0 0.20 0.14
Contractor Personnel: 25
Total on Site: 25 534 0 0 13 85 5 3,53 00 0 7 -1 1 0.9 0.22 -0.05

BIT ItECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out 1-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
3 12.250 BAKER HCDSO5ZX 7015752 323 7x13 2,839 0 - - - -

BIT OPERA ING PAl AMETERSTODAY
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vël HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max
3 23.50 43 00 617 ( ‡,128 0 26 3 26 10 0/14.0 60/100 0 907 T19 282 2 2 8

MUDDATA- NENPARK-AVA l.AST OR CURRENTBHA
Engineer: McDAN1EL/MOORE MBT: 0 0 lbm/bbl BHANo 3 Bit No 3 MD ín; 2,839 O ft
Sample From: OUT pH: 9.0 Pu ose: MD ut:
Mud Type: BRINE / POLYMER WBM Pml Pom:

rp

Time I MD: 0:01 / 3,852.0 Pf / Mf: 0.1 / 0.4 Component OD D Jts Len th
Density @ Temp: 9.90 / 92 Chlorides: 120,000 3DCBIT 12 250 1 1.34
Rheology Temp: 90 Ca+ I K+: / (OTARY STEERABLE MOT R 12 250 3 200 1 13.86
Viscosity: 45.00 CaCl2: MON-MAGINTEGRAL BLADE STABILI 12 130 2 810 1 6.40
PV I YP: 17 / 12 Clom: 3AVERSUB 8 250 2 880 1 3.39
Gels 10s/10m/30m:5 / 10 / 17 Lime: VlWDTOOL 8 250 6.250 1 24 24
API WL: 13.00 ES: VfWDTOOL 8 500 3 000 1 325
HTHP WL: ECD: 10.30 NON-MAG DRILL COLLAR 8 000 2.380 1 30 28
Cake API I HTHP: 2.0 / n / K I
Solids / Sol Corr: 3.90 /3.90 Carbonate:

MON-MAG INTEGRAI BLADESTAB 12 130 2 880 1 6 74

Oil I Water: / 96.1 Bicarbonate 3PIRAL DRILLCOLLAR 7 880 3 000 2 60 60
Sand: Form Loss: 304.0 / 904.0 3HOCK SUB 8 130 1.180 1 12.04
Water Added: Fluid Disch: / 3PIRAL DRILL COLLAR 7 630 2 880 7 210.63
Oil Added: 3ROŠSOVER 7 940 3 000 1 2 80
LGS 3 90 / 35.37 iWDP 5.000 3 000 4 123 06

Total Length 1 200.20 ft Wt below Jar 62,873 0 k
ADDING FRESH WATER AT 25 BBLS/HR TO REDUCE MUD WEIGHT
HOLE LOSSES AVERAGED 12.5 BBLS/HR, FOR A LOSS OF 304 BBLS
OVER LAST 24 HOURS.MIXING HOURLY LCM TREATMENTSAND

MUD PRCDUCT$
Product Units Qty Used

AQUABLOC 50 LBSlaK 84.00
CAUSTIC SODA 50 LB/SX 7.00 RECEIVED
DIALD 25 5 GAL/CN 2.00
ENG.24 HR #1 1 1.00 NOV21 2008ENG 24 HR #2 1 00
FLQW-ZAN 25 LB SX 10 00

cc
s

oo° DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING
NEWPAC R 50 LB/SX 10 00.
SALTGEL 50 LB/SX 200 00
SAWDUST 2000 LBS/S 15 00
SEA MUD 50 LBS/SK 80.00
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OXYUSA

DAILYOPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEY FEDERAL 35-1 Date: 11/15/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 51

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 6:00 6.00 21INDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 3350' TO 3480'.

UP WT= 220K; DN WT= 190K; RT WT= 205K; WOB= 10K; RPM= 100; TQ= 4; GPM
838= 2350 PSI.

6:00 16:00 10.00 21INDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 3480' TO 3763', 268' ROP 26.8

UP WT 220K
DWN 220K
ROT 215K
WOB 10 T/ 12K
PUMPS 2 @180SPM, 2415 PSI, 790 GPM.
RPMTQ2T/3K
PUMP 10 BBL OF 28 PPB LCM PILL EVERY 100'.

SPR #1 @30 SPM 110 PSI @45 SPM 220 PSI @ 3480'.
SPR #2 @30 SPM 100 PSI @45 SPM 190 PSI.

16:00 16:30 0.50 21]NDR RIGMT SRVRIG P SERVICE TOP DRIVE.
16:30 18:00 1.50 21\NDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 3763' TO 3780', 17" ROP 11.3

UP WT 220K
DWN 220K
ROT 215K
WOB 10 T/ 12K
PUMPS 2 @180SPM, 2415 PSI, 790 GPM.
RPM TQ 2 T/ 3K

LOST 125 BBLS, LOSS RATE 10.4 BBL/HR.
NO LATERAL VIBRATIONS.

18:00 0:00 6.00 21INDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 3780' TO 3947',

ROP 27.8
UP WT 222K
DWN 220K
ROT 220K
WOB 10 T/ 14K
PUMPS 2 @ 190SPM, 2535 PSI, 798 GPM.
RPM TQ 2 T/ 3K

LOSS RATE AVERAGE 12.5 BBL/HR.
NO LATERAL VIBRATIONS.

Total Time 24.00
Safety Inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 38.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 38.00 CLEAR; WIND 5 MPH EINE; AMBIENT TEMP 40 DEGREES; WIND CHILL 36
Incident Comments: UbeREES

No incidents reported last 24 hours. 2 Safe work permits
issued.
Other Remarks: DIESEL USED: 3180 GALS. DIESEL ON HAND: 11024 GALS. RECD 4000.

NO ACCIDENTS,NO SPILLS.

THIRD PARTY PERSONAL SIGNED IN = 5

MUD LOST FOR 24 HR = 304 BBLS
TOTAL MUD LOST TO WELL BORE = 340 BBLSTOTAL
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OXY SAONFIDENTIALAILXOPÈ TK)NS PARÏNER REPORT
Í..ATEAUVALLE FEDERAL 35-1 Date: 11/16/2008

Prim. Reason:0RIG DRILLVERT USÁ Report No 52
Wellbore 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB @7,92000ft DFS 16.19
Today's MD: 4,345.0 ft Progress: 378.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 3,967.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 23.50 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 16.1 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: TERTIARY@2,552 0 Lithology: TERTIARY: TOP FLAGSTAFF FM 3302'
Current Opo: DRILL12-1/4" HOLE W/ RSS.
24-Hr Summary: DRILL 12-1/4" HOLE W/ RSS.
24-Hr Forecast: DRILL 12-fl4" HOLE W/ F SS.

CASIAIGlWELLCONTROL HOOKLOAD & TOROUE HYDRAULICS MUDGAS Av Max
Last Casing: 13.375in @2,809ft Str Wt Up/Dn 230.0/ 230.0 kip Pump Rate: 795.4 Conn:
Next Casing: 9 625in @9,000ft Str Wt Rot: 230.0 kip Pump Press: 2,570.0 Trig):
Last BOP Press Test: 11/12/2008 Torq Off Btm 3,000 0 ff-Ibt Backgt:
Forni Test/EMW: FIT / 13.03 ppg Torq On Btm: 4,000 0 ft-Ibf

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA(LAST6)
Supervisor1: WADE FRAME NIO inci Azi TVD NI4 El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2 ROD MANIACl 4,291 0 0 69 302.41 4,290.98 2.9 -2 3 3.3 0.08 0 04
Engineet: RUSTY HANNA 4,195.0 0.56 309 18 4,194.99 2:3 -1.5 2 6 0.27 0.16
Geologist: KIRK SPARKMAN 4,099.0 0 40 335 02 4,098.99 1.7 -1.0 1 9 0.18 0.16
Oxy Personnel: 0 3,911.0 0 09 33573 3,910.99 f.0 -0 7 1 1 0.00 0.00
Conkactor Personnel 25 00707
Total on Site: 25

BIT ItECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
3 12250 BAKER RCD505ZX 7015752 323 7x13 2,839 0 - -

BIT OPERATING PAllAMETER$ TODAY
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog RÒP Cum RÒP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max
3 23.50 66.50 378.( †,506 0 16 1 22. 10.0/15.0 60/100 0 907 733 282.2 2 9

IUD DATA- NENPARK-AVA i.AST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: ED McDANIELS/ JASON MI MBT: 0.0 lbm/bbl BHANo: 3 Bit No: 3 MD in; 2,839 0 ft
Sample From: IN pH: 9.0 Pu se: MD Out:
Mud Type: BRINE / POLYMER WBM Pm / Pom:

rpo

Time / MD: 0:01 / 4,300.0 Pf / Mf: 0.1 / 0.3 Com onent OD ID Jts Length

Density @ Temp: 10.10 / 95 Chlorides: 162,000 DC BIT 12 250 1 1.34

Rheology Temp: 70 Ca+ / K+: / OTARY STEERABLE MOTOR 12.250 3 200 1 13.86
Viscosity: 45.00 CaCl2: MON-MAG INTEGRALBLADE STABIL 12 130 2 810 1 6.40
PV I YP: 14 / 11 Clom: 3AVER SUb 8.250 2 880 1 3.39
Gels 10s/10m/30m:3 / 12 / 17 Lime: VIWDTOOL 8.250 6 250 1 24.24
API WL: 11.60 ES: VIWDTOOL 8 500 3.000 1 3.25
HTHP WL: ECD: 10.30 NON-MAG DRILL COLLAR 8 000 2.380 1 30.28
CakeAP1/HTHP: 2.0/ n/K· / MON-MAGINTEGRAL BLADE STABILI2 12 130 2.880 1 6.74
Solids / Sol Corr: 2.50 / 2.50 Carbonate:
Oil / Water: 0.0 / 97.5 Bicarbonate: 3P)RAL DRILL COLLAR 7 880 3 000 2 60.60

Sand: 0.05 Form Loss: 162.0 / 1,066 0 3HOCK SUB 8 130 1180 1 12.04
Water Added: Fluid Disch: / 3PIRAL DRILL COLLAR 7 630 2 880 7 210.63
Oil Added: 3ROSSOVER 7 940 3.000 1 2.80
LGS: 2 50 / 22.68 iWDP 5.000 3 000 4 123.06
VG Meter: 3 3 / 4@6 / 11¾100 / 18(à!200 / 25@300 / 39¾600
Comments: DRILLING AT 4300 FEl T, RE-SATURATING Total Length: 1,200 20 ft Wt below Jars: 62,873.0 kip
BRINE-POLYMER SYSTEM BY SALT ADDITIONS. CONTINUING SALT
ADDITIONS TO +/- 190,000 CHLORIDES, AND 10.3 PPG. CURRENTLY
@162,000 CHLORIDES. LOSSES HAVE REDUCED TO ALMOST

MUD PRC DUCTS
Procluct Units Qty Used

AQUABLOC 50 LBS/SK 86.00
CAUSTIC SODA 50 LB/SX 4.00 RECElVED
DEFOAM X 5 GAL/CN 4.00
DIALD 25 5 GAL/CN 1.00 NOV2 1 2008
ENG 24 HR #1 1.00
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00
FLOW-ZAN 25 LB SX 9.00 OFOIL.GAS&MINING
MICA FINE 50 LB/SX 4.00
NEW CARB 50 LB/SX 6.00
PALLETS EA. 18.00
SALT 50 LBISX 687.00
SALTGEL 50 LBlŠX 130.00
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OXYUSA
DAILYOPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT

Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: 11/16/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 52

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 6:00 6.00 21lNDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 3947' TO 4115',

ROP 27.8
UP WT 222K
DWN 220K
ROT 220K
WOB 10 T/ 14K
PUMPS 2 @ 190SPM, 2535 PSI, 798 GPM.
RPM TQ 2 T/ 3K

SPR #1 @ 30 SPM 150 PSI @ 45 SPM 280 PSI @ 3948'.
SPR #2 @ 30 SPM 150 PSI @ 45 SPM 280 PSI.
LOSS RATE AVERAGE 12.5 BBL/HR.
NO LATERAL VlBRATIONS.

6:00 14:00 8.00 211NDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 4115' TO 4235, 120' ROP 15

UP WT 225K
DWN225K
ROT 225K
WOB 14 T/ 17K
PUMPS 2 @ 190SPM, 2225 PSI, 796 GPM.
RPM TQ 2 TI 4K

SPR #1 @ 30 SPM 140 PSI @ 40 SPM 200 PSI @4115".
SPR #3 @30 SPM 120 PSI @40 SPM 180 PSI.

14:00 14:30 0.50 21|NDR RIGMT SRVRIG P SERVICE TOP DRIVE.
14:30 18:00 3.50 21INDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 4235' TO 4263', 148' ROP 8

UP WT 225K
DWN 225K
ROT 225K
WOB 14 T/ 17K
PUMPS 2 @ 190SPM, 2225 PSI, 796 GPM.
RPM TQ 2 T/ 4K
NO LATERAL VIBRATIONS.

LOST 16 BBLS TO WELL BORE IN 12 HRS.
18:00 0:00 6.00 21INDR P DRILL FROM 4263' TO 4345', ROP 13.6

UP WT 225K DWN 225K ROT 225K
WOB14T/17K RPM90 TQ2TI4K
2 PUMPS @190 SPM, 796 GPM= 2570 PSI.

SPR #2 @30SPM= 110 PSI; @45SPM= 192 PSI
SPR #3 @30SPM= 110 PSI; @45SPM= 202 PSI

NO LATERAL VIBRATIONS.
NO NOTABLE LOSSES LAST 6 HOURS
LOST 162 BBLS TO WELL BORE LAST 24 HRS,

Total time 24.0C
Safety Inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 39.00 Weather Comments:
Environ incident? N Days since Last LTA: 39.00 CLEAR; WIND 8 MPH NE; AMBlENT TEMP 46 DEGREES; WIND CHILL 41 DEGREES
Incident Comrlents:
H2S DRILL @ i8:30 HRS, ALL PERSONAL ACCOUNTED
FOR.
Other Remarks: DIESEL USED: 2756 GALS. DIESEL ON HAND: 8480 GALS. RECD 0.

NO ACCIDENTS, NO SPILLS.

THIRD PARTY PERSONAL SIGNED IN = 5

MUD LOST FOR 24 HR = 162 BBLS
TOTAL MUD LOST TO WELL BORE = 502 BBLS

11/17/2008 11:12:43AM Page 2 of



PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: ijli /200
Prim Réason:0RIÒDR1LLVER USA ReportÑo 53

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB @7,92000ft DFS: 17.19
Today's MD: 4,785.0 ft Progress: 440.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost: $123,872
Prev MD: 4,345.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 23.50 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost: $4,792,696
PBMD: Avg ROP Today 18.7 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost: $12,804,200
Current Formation: TERTIARY@2,552.0 Lithology: TERTIARY: TOP FLAGSTAFF FM 3302'
Current Ops: DRILL 12-1/4" HOLE WI RSS T/ 4785
24-Hr Summary: DRILL 12-1/4" HOLE Wl RSS.
24-Hr Forecast: DRILL12-1/4" HOLE Wl F SS.

CASINGlWELLCONTROL IOOKLOAD&TOROUE 14YDRAULIC MUDGAS Avg : Max
Last Casing: 13 375in @2,809ft Str Wt UplDn: 235 0/ 235 0 kip Pump Rate: 795.3 onn:
Next Casing: 9 625in @9,000ft Str WtRot: 235.0 kip Pump Press: 4,762.0 p:
Last BOP Press Test: 11/12/2008 Torq Off Btm 3,000 0 ft-Ibt ackgr:
Form Test/EMW: EIT / 13.03 ppg Torq On Btm: 4,000.0 ft-Ibt

PERSONWEL $URVEY DATA(LAS1 6}
Supervisor 1: WADE FRAME MD nel Azi TVO NIL$ 1-W VS DLŠ uild
Supervisor 2: ROD MANIÁCI 4,768 0 27 328.93 4,860.95 7.2 -5 9 8.2 0.54 0.51
Yngineer: RUSTY HANNA 4,671.0 0.19 337.27 4,76596 5.7 -5 1 6.5 0.30 0.24
Geologist: KIRK SPARKMAN 4,575.0 0.58 322.55 4,669.97 4.7 -4 6 6.6 0 11 0.09
Oxy Personnel: 0 4,482 0 .48 314.72 4,578.98 4.1 -4 0 4.8 0.22 -0.09

Contractor Personnel: 25
.

-
. .

Total on Site: 25 5 5. .

-

BIT REC RD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No lADC Nozzles MD In MDOut I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
3 12.250 BAKER CD505ZX 7015752 323 7x13 2,839 0 - -

MUD DATA - NE NPARK-AVA 1.ASTOR CURRENTBHA
Engineer: ED McDANIELSI JASON MI MBT: 0 0 lbm/bbi BHANo: 3 Bit No: 3 MD In: 2,839.0 ft
Sample From: PIT pH: 9.5 Purpose: MDOut:
Mud Type: BRINE / POLYMER WBM Pm I Pom: Com onent OD ID Jts Len th
Time I MD: 0:01 / 4,712.0 Pf I Mf: 0.1 / 0.5
Density @Temp: 10.40 / 105 Chlorides: 207,000 DC BIT 12.250 1 1.34

Rheology Temp: 70 Ca+ / K+: /
Viscosity: 43.00 CaCl2: MON-MAG IN I EGRAL BLADE S IABILI 12.130 2.810 1 6.40
PV I YP: 14 / 12 Clom: SAVER SUB 8.250 2.880 1 3.39
Gels 10s/10m/30m:5 / 12 / 19 Lime: VIWDIOOL 8.250 6.2b0 1 24.24
API WL: 14.60 ES:

.5 . . 5
HTHP WL: ECD: 10.44
Cake API I HTHP: 2.0 / n I K: /
Solids I Sol Corr: 1.60 / 1.60 Carbonate:
Oil I Water: 0.0 / 98.4 Bicarbonate: SPIRALDRILLCOLLAR 7.880 3 000 2 60 60
Sand: 0.05 Form Loss: 64.0 / 1,130.0 SHOCKSUB 8.130 1.180 1 12.04
Water Added: Fluid Disch: / SPIRAL DRILL COLLAR 7.630 2 880 7 210.63
Oil Added:
LGS: 1.60 / 14.51
VG Meter: 4@3/ 5@6 / 14 100 / 21 200 / 26W300 / 40M600
Comments: DRILLINGAT4712 FEE I, SATURAIt-D BRINE-POLYMERTotal Length: 1,200.20 ft Wt below Jars: 62,873.0 kip
SYSTEM BY SALT ADDITIONSTO OVER 200,000 CHLORIDES, AND
10.4PPG. CURRENTLY AT 207,000 CHLORJDES. HOLE LOSSES
AVERAGED 2.6 BBLS/HR, FOR A LOSS OF 64 BBLSOVER LAST 24

MUD.PRODUCTú
Product Units Qty Used

AQUA BLOC 50 LBS/SK 34.00
CAUSTICSODA 50 LBISX 9.00 RECEIVED
DEFOAM X 5 GAL/CN 2.00
DIALD25 5 GAL/CN 2.00
DYNA DET 5 GAL/CAN 10.00 NOV2 1 2008
ENG 24 HR#1 1 1.00
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00
FLOW-ZAN 25 LB SX 7.00 I
LIME 50 LB/SX 15.00
MICA FINE 50 LBlŠX 24.00
NEW CARB 50 LB/SX 39.00
NEWEASE 203 5 GAL/CN 2.QO
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OXYUSA

DAILYOPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: 11/17/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 53

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 6:00 6.00 21\NDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 4345' TO 4420', ROP 12.5

UP WT 225K DWN 225K ROT 225K
WOB 12 T/ 20K RPM 110 TQ 2 Tl 4K
2 PUMPS @200 SPM, 838 GPM= 2544 PSI.

MINIMALMUD LOSSES TO HOLE INLAST 6 HRS
NO LATERAL VIBRATIONS.

6:00 14:30 8.50 21]NDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 4420' TO 4615', 195' ROP 24' HR.

UP WT 230K DWN230K ROT 230K
WOB 25K RPM 110 TQ 2 TI 6K
2 PUMPS @198 SPM, 828 GPM= 2530 PSI.

14:30 15:00 0.50 211NDR RIGMT SRVRIG P SERVICE RIG.
15:00 18:00 3.00 21INDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 4615' TO 4666', 51' ROP 17' HR.

UP WT 230K DWN230K ROT 230K
WOB 25K RPM 110 TQ 3 T/ 8K
2 PUMPS @198 SPM, 828 GPM= 2500 PSI.

24 BBLS LOST TO WELL BORE IN 12 Hrs.
NO LATERAL VlBRATIONS.

18:00 0:00 6.00 21\NDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 4666' TO 4785', 119' ROP 20' HR.

UP WT 235K DWN235K ROT 235K
WOB 30K RPM 110 TQ 3 T/ 6K
2 PUMPS @198 SPM, 828 GPM= 2535 PSI.

64 BBLS MUD LOST TO WELL IN LAST24 HRS
NO LATERAL VIBRATIONS.

Total time 24.00
Safety Inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 40.00 Weather Comments:
Environ incident? N Days since Last LTA: 40.00 CLEAR; WIND 5 MPH SE; AMBIENTTEMP 50 DEGREES; WIND CHILL 48 DEGREES
Incident Comments:
No incidents reported last 24 hours.

Other Remarks: DIESEL USED: 3180 GALS. DIESEL OF HAND:9328 GALS. RECD: 4,000 GALLONS.

NO ACCIDENTS, NO SPILLS.

THIRD PARTY PERSONAL SIGNED IN = 5

MUD LOST FOR 24 HR = 64 BBLS
TOTALMUDLOST TO WELLBORE = 606 BBLS
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CONRDENTIAL ER ER REPO
PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35 Date: 11/180008

Prim. Reason:0RIG DRILLVERT USA Repórt No 54

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINALKB @7,92000ft DFS: 18 19
Today's MD: 5,174.0 ft Progress: 389.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 4,785.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 23.50 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 16.6 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: ARAP)EN SHALE@4,720.0 Lithology: ARAPIEN SHALE: SHALE, SILTSTONE, ANHYDRATE SALT.
Current Ops: DRILL 12-fl4" HOLE W/ RSS.
24-Hr Summary: DRILL 12-1/4" HOLE W/ RSS.
24-Hr Forecast: DRILL 12-1/4" HOLlÉW/ F SS

CASINGlWELLCONTROL NOOKLOAD&TOROUE HYDRAULICS MUDGAS Av Max
Last Casing: 13.375in @ 2,809ft Str Wt Up/Dn: 235.0/ 235 0 kip Pump Rate: 812 1 Conn:
Next Casing: 9 625in @9,000ft Str Wt Rot: 235 0 ki Pump Press: 2,725 0 Trip:
Last BOP Press Test: 11/12/2008 Torq Off Btm: 3,000 0 ft-I Backgr:
Form Test/EMW: FIT / 13.03 ppg Torg On Btm: 4,000 0 ft-i

PERSORNEL SURVEY DATA(LAST6)
Supervisor 1: WADE FRAME MD inct Azi TVD Ní-S El-W VS DLS Bulld
Supervisor 2; RO0 MANIACí 5,051 0 1 33 315 08 5,050.68 11.7 -10.2 13.4 0.12 0.12
Engineer: RUSTY HANMA 4 956 0 1 22 314.31 4,955.90 10.2 -8 7 11 7 0.18 -0.16

Geologist: KIRKSPARKMAN 4,830 0 1 42 318.37 4,829 93 8 1 -6 7 9.2 0.39 0.23
Oxy Personnel: 0
Contractor Personnel: 25 4,671 0 0.79 337.27 4,670 97 5 4 -4.9 6.3 0.30 0.24
Total on Site: 25 4 575 0 0 56 322.55 4,574 97 4 5 -4.4 5.2 0.11 0 09

SIT RECOÑD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No lADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
3 12.250 BAKER RCD505ZX 70‡5752 323 7x13 2,839 0 5 179 0 5-1-CT-N D-I-BT-WO

BIT OPERATING PAflAl IETERS TODA
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max
3 23.50 113.50 389.( 2,335.0 16. 20. 20.0/35 0 90/110 0 907 772 288.2 3 1

IMIUDDATA - NE NPARK-AVA AST R Ct RRENT BHA
Engineer: ED McDANIELS/ JASON MI MBT: 0.0 lbm/bbl EHANo: 3 Bit No: 3 MD in: 2 839 0 ft
Sample From: PIT pH: 9.5 Pu ose: MD ut: 5 179 O ft
Mud Type: BRINE / POLYMER WBM Pm I Pom:

rp

Time / MD: 0:01 / 5,104.0 Pf I Mf: 0.2 / 0.5 Component OD ID Jts Len th
Density @Temp: 10.40 / 105 Chlorides: 183,000 'DC BIT 12 250 1 1.34

Rheology Temp: 120 Ca+ / K+: I (OTARY STEERABLE MOTOR 12 250 3.200 1 13.86
Viscosity: 48.00 CaCl2: NON-MAG INTEGRAL BLADE STABILI 12.130 2.810 1 6.40
PV / YP: 18 / 10 Clom: 3AVER SUB 8 250 2 880 1 3 39
Gels 10s/10m/30m:3 / 15 / 17 Lime: VIWDTOOL 8 250 6.250 1 24.24
API WL: 12.80 ES: VlWDTOOL 8 500 3 000 1 3.25
HTHP WL: ECD: 10.48 MON-MAG DRILL COLLAR 8 000 2.380 1 30.28
Cake API / HTHP: 2.0 / n / K /
Solids / Sol Corr: 3.50 / 3.50 Carbonate:

NON-MAG INTEGRALBLADE STABILl2 12 130 2.880 1 6.74

Oil I Water: 0.0 / 96.5 Bicarbonate: 3PIRAL DRILLCOLLAR 7 880 3 000 2 60.60

Sand: 0.05 Form Loss: 0.0 / 1,130.0 SHOCK SUB 8 130 1.180 1 12.04
Water Added: Fluid Disch: / 3PIRAL DRILL COLLAR 7 630 2.880 7 210.63
Oil Added: 3ROSSOVER 7 940 3.000 1 2.80
LGS: 3 50 / 31.75 iWDP 5 000 3 000 4 123.06
VG Meter: 2 3 / 3@6 / 12@100 / 19 200 / 28@300 / 46 600
Comments: DRILLING AHEAD ANE ADDING SATURATED BRINE A$ Total Length 1,200.20 ft Wt below Jars: 62,873.0 kip
NEEDED FOR MAKE-UP. DRILLED FROM 4712 TO 5104 FEET, LAST 24
HOURS. NO SALTDRILLED AS YET, BUT IT IS LIKELY ANYTIME. NO
RECORDABLE LOSSES LAST 24 HOURS; ONLY FOR FORMATION

MUD PRC DUCTS
Product Units Qty Used

CAUSTIC SODA 50 LB/SX 6.00
DEFOAM X 5 GALICN 4.00 RECEIVED
DIALD 25 5 GAL/CN 1.00
DYNA DET 5 GAL/CAN 14.00 NOV2 1 2008ENG 24 HR #1 1.00
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00
FLOW-ZAN 25 LB SX 11.00 DIVOFOlLGAS&MININGLIME 50 LB/SX 13.00
MICA FINE 50 LB/SX 12.00
NEW CARB 50 LB/SX 26.00
NEWEASE 203 5 GAL/CN 7.00
NEWPAC R 50 I B/SX 15.00
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OXYUSA
DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT

Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: 11/18/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 54

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 1:00 1.00 21INDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 4785' TO 4804', 19' ROP 19' HR.

UP WT 235K DWN 235K ROT 235K
WOB 30K RPM 110 TQ 3 T/ 6K
2 PUMPS @198 SPM, 828 GPM= 2535 PSI.

NO LATERAL VIBRATIONS.
1:00 1:30 0.50 21INDR RIGMT SRVRIG P SERVICE RIG.
1:30 6:00 4.50 21INDR DRfLL RSS P DRILL FROM 4804' TO 4850', 46' ROP 10.2' HR.

DRILL 20K WOB FOR DIRECTIONAL F/ 4810' T/ 4830' DRILL REMAINDER WITH
WOB 25K TO HELP RSS STEER ANGLE DOWN.

CK SHOT SURVEY DEPTH 4804' 1.2 INC 321.08 AZ
CONSULT WITH ENGINEER. DISCUSSED PLAN TO DRILL AHEAD WITH 30K WOB
AND SEE IF ANGLE CONTINUES TO BE AN ISSUE.

UP WT 235K DWN 235K ROT 235K
WOB 25K RPM 110 TQ 3 TI 6K
2 PUMPS @ 198 SPM, 828 GPM= 2535 PSI.

SPR #1@ 30 SPM= 122 PSI @45 SPM= 236 PSI
SPR #2@ 30 SPM= 110 PSI @45 SPM= 197 PSI
NO LATERAL VIBRATIONS.

6:00 18:00 12.00 21INDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 4850' TO 5050, 200' ROP 16.6' HR.

UP WT 235K DWN 235K ROT 235K
WOB 25K RPM 110 TQ 3 T/ 8K
2 PUMPS @194 SPM, 808 GPM= 2737 PSI.

NO LATERAL VIBRATIONS.
NO LOSSES REPORTED FOR LAST 12 HOURS.

18:00 0:00 6.00 21\NDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 5050' TO 5174, 124' ROP 20.6' HR.

UP WT 245K DWN 245K ROT 245K
WOB 25K RPM 110 TQ 3 TI 8K
2 PUMPS @ 194 SPM, 808 GPM= 2737 PSI.

SPR #2@ 30 SPM= 102 PSI @ 45 SPM= 200 PSI
SPR #3@ 30 SPM= 118 PSI @ 45 SPM= 222 PSI
NO LATERAL VIBRATIONS.
NO RECORDABLE LOSSES FOR LAST 24 HOURS.

Total time 24.00
Safety Inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 41.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 41.00 CLEAR; WIND 6 MPH SSW; AMBIENT TEMP 45 DEGREES; WIND CHILL 42
Incident Comments: DEGREES

H2S DRILL @18:30 HRS. ALL HANDS PARTICIPATED, AND
ACCOUNTED FOR.
Other Remarks: DIESEL USED: 2756 GALS. DIESEL ON HAND: 10,600 GALS. RECD: 4,000 GALLONS.

NO ACCIDENTS,NO SPILLS.

THIRDPARTY PERSONAL SIGNED IN = 5

MUD LOST TO WELL BORE LAST 24 HR = 0 BBLS
TOTAL MUD LOST TO WELL BORE = 606 BBLS
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CONFIDENTIALu.voeuxr RTNER REPORT
PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-T Date: 11/19/Ž008

Prim. Réason:0RIG DRILL VERT USA Report No 55

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NÁBORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINALKB @7,92000ft DFS: 19.19
Today's MD: 5,310.0 ft Progress: 136.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 5,174.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 6.50 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today 20.9 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: ARAPIENSHALE@4,720.0 Lithology: ARAP1EN SHALE:SHALE, SILTSTONE,ANHYDRATE SALT.
Current Opä DRILL12-1/4" HOLE W/ RSS.
24-Hr Summary: DRILL 12-1/4" HOLE W/ RSS. / TRIP ÓÜT FOR WASH OUT / CHANGE BlT RSS / TRIP IN TÖBOTTOM / DRILL12-1/4" HOLE V
24-Hr forecast: TRIP OUT OF HOLE / RE IZE BIT NOZZELS/ TRIP BACK TO BOTTOM/ DRILL12-174" HOLEWI RSS.

CASINGlWELLCONTROL ÑOOKLOAD& TOROUE HYDRAULICS MUDGAS Av Max
Last Casing: 13.375in 2,809ft Str Wt UplDn: / Pump Rate: 619.5 Conn:
Next Casing: 9.625in 9,000ft Str Wt Rot: Pump Press: 2,275.0 Trip:
Lást BOP Press Test: 11/12 2008 Torq Off Btm Backgr:
Forni Test/EMW: FIT / 13.03 ppg Torq On Btm:

PERSONNEL Suk VEY DATA(LAST6)
Supervisor 1: WADE FRAME MD incl A I TVD NÍA El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2 ROD MANIACí 5,229 0 0 06 221 55 5,228.84 13 7 -12.7 15.9 1.52 -1.46

Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 5,135.0 1 43 307 85 5,134.85 13 D -11.7 15 0 0.24 0.12
Geologist KIRKSPARKMAN 6,051.0 1.33 316 08 5,050 88 11 7 -10.2 13 4 0.12 0.12
Oxy Personnel: 0 4,956.0 1.22 314 31 4,955 90 10 2 -8.T 11 0.18 -0.16

Connactor Personnel: 25 4,830.0 1.42 318 37 4 829 93 8 1 -6.7 9.2 0.39 0.23
Total on Site: 25 4,766 0 1 27 326 93 4,765.95 6 9 -5.8 7.9 0.54 0 51

BIT RECOAD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B G-O-R

Code
4 12.500 HYCALOG RSR 619m A-2 220440 422 6x12 5,179 0 5 310 0 0-0-NO-A 0-1-NO-PN

3 12.250 BAKER HCD5052X 7015752 323 7x13 2,839.0 5 179 O 5-1-CT-N D-WBT-WO

BIT OPERATING PARAMETERSTODAŸ
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max
4 6 00 6 00 131.0 131.0 21.8 21. 10 0120.0 90/110 0 663 846 3QQ.2 2 5
3 0 50 114 00 51 2,340.0 10.0 20. 30.0/35 0 100/110 0 907 744.6 282.9 2 9

IUIUDDATA- NENPARK-AVA LASTÒR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: BILL DESHOTELS/ JASON MBT: BHANo: 4 Bit No 4 MD in 5 179 0 ft
Sample From: PIT pH: 9.5 Purpose MD ut: 5 310 0 ft
Mud Type: BRINE / POLYMER WBM Pm I Pom: Com onent OD 10 Jts Len th
Time I MD: 0:01 / 5,303.0 Pf I Mf: 0.2 / 0.5
Density @Temp: 10.40 / 105 Chlorides: 188,000

>DC BIT 12.250 1 0.95

Rheology Temp: 120 Ca+ l K+: / IOTARYSTEERABLE MOTOR 12.250 3 200 1 13.86
Viscosity: 47.00 CaCl2: MON-MAG INTEGRAL BLADE STABIL 12 130 2.810 1 6.40
PV I YP: 17 / 16 Clom: 3AVER SUB 8 250 2 880 1 3.39
Gels 10s/10m/30m:4 / 6 / 16 Lime: VIWDTOOL 8 250 6.250 1 24.24
API WL: 11.70 ES: VIWOTOOL 8 500 3.000 1 3.25
HTHP WL: ECD: 10.48 NON-MAG DRILL COLLAR 8 000 2.380 1 30.28
Cake API I HTHP: 2.0 / n / K /
Solids / Sol Corr: 3.10 / 3.10 Carbonate:

MON-MAG INTEGRAL BLADE STABIL 12.130 2 880 1 6.74

Oil / Water: 0.0 / 96.9 Bicarbonate: 3PIRAL DRILL COLLAR 7.880 3.000 2 60.60

Sand: 0.05 Form Loss: 25.0 / 1,155 0 3PIRAL DRILL COLLAR 7.630 2 880 7 210.63
Water Added: Fluid Disch: / 3ROSSOVER 7.940 3 000 1 2.80
Oil Added: 1WDP 5 000 3 000 4 123.06
LGS: 3 10 / 28.12 3RILLING JAR 6 250 2 750 1 29.64
VG Meter: 3 3 4@6 / 14@100 / 22 200 i33@300 / 50 600
Comments: DRILL TO 5179FT, POOH FOR WASHOUT FIND Total Lengthi 1,187.77 ft Wt below Jars: 62 873 0 kip
WASHOUT7 JOINTS DOWN& CHANGE OUT JOINT. CONTINUETO
POOH, SLIP/CUT DRILL LINE.WHEN FINISH POOH, CHANGE OUT PDC
BIT & RIH NO PROBLEMS.

MUD PRC DUCTS
Product Units Qty Used

CAUSTIC SODA 50 LB/SX 1.00
DYNA DET 5 GAL/CAN 4.00 RECEIVED
ENG 24 HR #1 1 1 00
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1 00
FLOW-ZAN 25 LB SX 1 00 *

LIME 50 LBlŠX 7 00
MICA FINE 50 LBlŠX 20.00
NEW CARB 50 LB/SX 20.00 DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING
NEWEASE 203 5 GAL/CN 6 00
PALLETS EA. 62.00
SALTGEL 50 LBlŠX 13.00
SHRINK WRAP EA. 71.00
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OXYUSA

DAILYOPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEY FEDERAL35-1 Date: 11/19/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 55

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 0:30 0.50 21lNDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 5174' TO 5179, 5' ROP 10' HR.

UP WT 245K DWN 245K ROT 245K
WOB30K RPM110 TQ3Tl8K
2 PUMPS @ 194 SPM, 808 GPM= 2240 PSI.

NO LATERAL VIBRATIONS.
0:30 1:30 1.00 21INDR OTHR OTHER PT INVESTIGATE 300 PSI PRESSURE LOST. UNABLE TO FIND ANY LEAKS ON

SURFACE. CONSULT WITH TOWN &TRIP OUT OF THE HOLE.
1:30 5:30 4.00 21lNDR TRIP WSHO PT TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR WASHOUT.

TIGHT 25K @4000' TO 3985' & 3908' TO 3898'

FOUND WASHOUT IN DP, 4 STANDS FROM HWDP. CHANGE OUT 1 JOINT OF DP.
TRIP OUT TO JARS.

5:30 6:00 0.50 21\NDR RIGMT REP PT REPAIR LEAKINGHOSE ON IRON ROUGHNECK
6:00 9:30 3.50 21INDR TRIP WSHO PT TRIP OUT OF THE HOLE, LAY DOWN SHOCK SUB, BIT AND POWERDRIVE TOOL.
9:30 10:30 1.00 21INDR TRIP WSHO PT PICK UP NEW HYCALOGRSR619m A-22, FRESH POWERDRIVE TOOL.

10:30 12:30 2.00 21INDR TRIP WSHO PT TRIP IN HOLE TO 2811' SHALLOW HOLE TEST MWD
12:30 14:00 1.50 21INDR RIGMT SRVRIG P SLIP &CUT DRILLINGLINE, RIG SERVICE
14:00 18:00 4.00 21INDR TRIP WSHO PT TRIP IN HOLE TO 5179'. WASH DOWN 70'. NO ADVERSE HOLE CONDITIONS

WHILE TRIPPING IN HOLE.
WHEN WASHING TO BOTTOM, SURFACE PRESSURE WAS NOTABLY HIGH AT 720
GPM. FLOW RATE WAS DROPPED TO 620 GPM MAXIMUM.

18:00 0:00 6.00 21INDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 5179' TO 5310, 131' ROP 21.8' HR.

CONFER WITH ENGINEER. FLOW RATE OF 620 GPM WAS BELOWMINIMAL
ACCEPTABLE FOR HOLE CLEANINGFACTORS. TRIP OUT OF THE HOLE TO
OPEN UP NOZZLES ON BIT FOR 750 TO 800 GPM MAXIMUM.

UP WT 245K DWN 245K ROT 245K
WOB20K RPM110 TQ3T/8K
2 PUMPS @148 SPM, 618 GPM= 2275 PSI.

NO LATERAL VIBRATIONS.
Total time 24.00

Safety Inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 42.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 42.00 CLEAR; WIND 8 MPH WEST; AMBIENT TEMP 20 DEGREES; WIND CHILL 10
Incident Comments:

DEUREl-8

No incidents reported last 24 hours.

Other Remarks: DIESEL USED: 1686 GALS. DIESEL ON HAND: 12580 GALS. RECD: 4000 GALS.

NO ACCIDENTS, NO SPILLS.

THIRD PARTY PERSONAL SIGNED IN = 5

MUD LOST TO WELL BORE LAST 24 HR = 25 BBLS
TOTAL MUD LOST TO WELL BORE = 631 BBLS

11/21/2008 8:48:09AM Page 2 of



OXYUSACONFIDENTIALILÝOPÈRATiONS PARTNER REPORT
PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 354 Date- 11/20/2008

Prim. Reason:0RIÒDRILLVERT USA Report Ño 56
Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB @7,92000ft DFS: 20.19
Today's MD: 5,634.0 ft Progress: 324.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 5,310.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 13.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 24.9 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost
Current Formation: ARAPIEN SHALE@4,720.0 L.ithology: ARAPIEN SHALE: SHALE SILTSTONE, ANNYDRATE SALT
Current Ops: DRILL12-1/4" HOLE W/ RSS Tl 5634
24-Hr Summary: TRIP FOR NOZZELS/ DRILL 12-1/4" HOLE W/ RSS.
24-Hr Forecast DRILL 12-1/4" HOLIÉW/ E SS.

CASINGlWELL CONTROL HOOKLOAD TORQUE HYDRAULICS NIUD.GAS Av lax
Last Casing: 13.375in @ 2,809ft Str Wt UplDn: I Pump Rate: 795.4 Cono:
Next Casing: 9.625in § 9,000ft Str Wt Rot: Pump Press: 2,775 0 Trip:
Last BOP Press Test: 11/12/2008 Torq Off Btm Backgt:
Form Test/EMW: FIT / 13.03 ppg Torq On Btm

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA(LASTS)
Supervisor 1: WADE FRAME MU incl Az! TVD NIA El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2: ROD MANIÁCí 5 515 0 0 09 4721 5,514.84 13.7 -12.7 15.9 0.19 0.00
Engineer: RUSTY HANNA $ 421.0 0 09 222 16 5,420 84 13.7 -12.7 15 9 0 14 0.03
Geologist: KIRK SPARKMAN 5 325 0 0 06 353 17 5,324 84 13 7 -12 7 15 9 0 11 0.00
Oxy Personnel: 0
Connactor Personnel: 25
Total on Site: 25 5,051 1 33 315 08 5,050.88 11 / -10 2 13 4 0 12 0.12

BIT RECO D
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
5 12.250 HYCALOG RSR 619m A-2 220440 422 Ox12 5,310 0
4 12.500 HYCALOG RSR 819m A-2 220440 422 6x12 5,179 0 5,310 0 0-0-NO-A 0-1-NO-PN

BIT OPERATING PARAMETERSTODAY
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max
5 13.00 13 00 324.0 324 0 24.9 24. 20 0/25.0 100/105 0 884 7701 285.0 3 0
4 0.00 6 00 0 131.0 0.0 21. 0.0/0.0 0/0 0.6ð3 0 C 0.0 0.0

MUD DATA- NENPARK-AVA LAST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: BILL DESHOTELS/ JASON MBT: BHANo: 5 Bit No: 5 MD In; 5,310.0 ft
Sample From: PIT pH: 9.7 Pu ose: MD ut:
Mud Type: BRINE / POLYMER WBM Pm / Pom:

r

Time I MD: 0:01 / 5,550.0 Pf I Mf: 0.7 / 0.7 Component D 10 Jts Lengtfi

Density @ Temp: 10.50 / 105 Chlorides: 191,000
>DC BIT 12.250 1 0.95

Rheology Temp: 120 Ca+ / K+: / (OTARY STEERABLE MOTOR 12.250 3.200 1 13.86
Viscosity: 51.00 CaCl2: MON-MAG INTEGRAL BLADE STABIL 12 130 2.810 1 6.40
PV I YP: 21 / 19 Clom: 3AVER SUB 8.250 2.880 1 3.39
Gels 10s/10m/30m:4 / 14 / 21 Lime: VlWDTOOL 8.250 6.250 1 24.24
API WL: 11.80 ES: VlWDTOOL 8.500 3.000 1 3.25
HTHP WL: ECD: 10.50 NON-MAGDRILL COLLAR 8.000 2.380 1 30.28

edsA HCoHr:: 2370/
/ 3.70

rKbonate: NON-MAG INTEGRAL BLADE STABILI 12.130 2.880 1 6.74
Oil / Water: 0.0 / 96.3 Bicarbonate: 3PIRAL DRILL COLLAR 7.880 3.000 2 60.60

Sand: 0.05 Form Loss: 15.0 / 1,170.0 SPlRAL DRILL COLLAR 7630 2.880 7 210.63
Water Added: Fluid Disch: I 3ROSSOVER 7 940 3 000 1 2.80
Oil Added: 1WDP 5 000 3.000 4 123.06
LGS: 3.70 / 33.56 3RILLING JAR 6 250 2.750 1 29.71
VG Meter:
Comments: TRIPPED OUT OF THE HOLE HANDLE BHA BREAK BIT, Total Length 1,187.84 ft Wt below Jars: 37,148 0 kip
PULLED 2 JETS. MAKE BIT BACK AND CLEANED OUT FILTER SUB.
TRIPPED BACK IN TO TO TEST TOOL OUTSIDE SHOE AT 2900 FEET.
INSTALLED ROTATlNG HEAD 200 FEET OFF BTM. WASH AND REAM

MUD PRC DUCTS
Product Units Oty used

CAUSTIC SODA 50 LBlŠX 0 00
DEFOAMX SGALICN 4.00 RECEIVED
DYNADET 5 GAL/CAN 3.00
DYNA-FIBER 25 LBS 20.00 NOV2 1 2008ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00
FLMOEW-ZAN 25 B SX 10 00 DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINING
MICAFINE 50 LB/SX 10.00
NEW BAR 100 LB/SX 40.00
NEW CARB 50 LBISX 68.00
NEWEASE 203 5 GAL/CN 4.00

11/21/2008 8:57:26AM Page 1 of



OXY USA

DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEY FEDERAL35-1 Date: 11/20/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 56

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 1:30 1.50 211NDR CIRC CNDHOL PT CIRCULATE SWEEP AROUND TO CONDITION HOLE
1:30 6:00 4.50 21INDR TRIP DRILL PT TRIP OUT OF HOLE. CHANGE OUT JARS. SHALLOW HOLE TEST POWERDRIVE

500 GPM, REDRESS BIT.
6:00 8:30 2.50 21INDR TRIP BHA PT RE NOZZLE BIT, CLEAN OUT SCREEN ON TOP OF FILTER SUB, RUN IN THE HOLE

TO 2805' SHALLOW HOLE TEST MWD. GOOD TEST.
8:30 10:30 2.00 21INDR TRIP DRILL PT RUN IN THE HOLE FROM 2805' TO 5265'.

10:30 11:00 0.50 21]NDR REAM PRRM PT WASH AND REAM FROM 5265' TO 5309'. FAN BOTTOM
11:00 18:00 7.00 21|NDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 5310' TO 5522', 212' ROP 30.3' HR.

UP WT 252K DWN 240K ROT 245K
WOB 25K RPM 105 TQ 3 TI 8K
2 PUMPS @ 188 SPM, 796 GPM= 2990 PSI.

NO LATERAL VIBRATIONS.
10 BBLS LOST TO WELL BORE IN 12 HR.

18:00 0:00 6.00 21INDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 5522' TO 5634', 112' ROP 18.6' HR.

UP WT 252K DWN 240K ROT 245K
WOB 25K RPM 105 TQ 3 T/ 8K
2 PUMPS @188 SPM, 796 GPM= 2990 PSI.

NO LATERAL VIBRATIONS.
57 BBLS LOST TO WELL BORE IN 6 HR.

Total Time 24.0C
Safety inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 43.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 43.00 CLEAR; WIND 7 MPH WEST; AMBlENT TEMP 26 DEGREES; WIND CHILL 18
incident Comments: Jikil¯U

No incidents reported last 24 hours. 2 Safe work permits
issued.
Other Remarks: DIESEL USED: 2756 GALS. DIESEL ON HAND: 13,992 GALS. RECD: 4000 GALS.

NO ACCIDENTS, NO SPILLS.

THIRD PARTY PERSONAL SIGNED IN = 5

MUD LOST TO WELL BORE LAST 24 HR = 67 BBLS
TOTAL MUD LOST TO WELL BORE = 698 BBLS

11/21/2008 8:57:26AM Page 2 of



00NFllERLROVEDForm 3160-5 UNITED STATES OMB No. 1004-0137(August2007) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires: July 31, 2010
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

UTU-81364
SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

Do not use this form for proposals to dri/I or to re-enter an N/A
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on page 2. 7. If Unit of CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
N/A

1. Type of Well

Oil Well Gas Well Other 8 NË\eaydFeNd
ral 35-1

2. Name of Operator 9. API Well No.
OXY USA Inc. 4304130060

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool or Exploratory Area
oO.s

on
T7X77577227-7757

{970) 263-3637 Exploratory

4. Location of Well {Footage, Sec., T.,R.,M, or SurveyDescription) I1. Country or Parish, State
Section 35, Township 25 South, Range i West, SLB&M
At surface: 868' FNL, 734' FEL, being in NE4NE4 At prod. zone: 868' FNL,734' FEL, being in NE4NE4 Sevier, UT (041)

12. CHECK THE APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT OR OTHER DATA

YPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off
.

O sitercasing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation: Clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof. If
the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports mustbe filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 must be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices must be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

OXY USA Inc. (OXY) is providing notice of change to the drilling plan for the Plateau Valley Federal 35-1 well. OXY will continue to set 9 5/8" casing to a
max depth of 12,000' or to the middle of the Navajo formation, whichever comes first. This change to the Plateau Valley Federal 35-1 drilling plan is because
OXY has not identified the Salt section, or the Twin Creek and Navajo formations. Verbal approval was received from Al McKee with the BLMon December 5,
2008 regarding the change to the drilling plan.

COPYSENTTOOPERATOR

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct. Name (Printed/Typed)

Daniel I. Padilla Title Regulatory Coordinator

Signature Date

Approvedby

ACE FOR FEDERALTOR STATE OFFICE USE

Date
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or certify
that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to thoserights in the subject lease which would Office
entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. ActionisNecessary
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowinglyand willfully to make to any department or agency of the
fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2) DEC1O2008
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



Attachment for 12000' of Intermediate 9-5/8" Casing Sundry Notice

Surface Intermediate Prod Liner
Casing O. D. (in) 13.375 9.625 5.500
Casing Grade J-55 HCL-80 L-80
Weight of Pipe (Ibs/ft) 68.0 53.5 20.0
Connection BTC BTC LTC

Top Setting Depth - MD (ft) 0 0 8500
Top Setting Depth - TVD (ft) 0 0 8500
Bottom Setting Depth - MD (ft) 3000 12000 14000
Bottom Setting Depth - TVD (ft) 3000 12000 14000
Maximum Mud Weight - Inside (ppg) 9.2 10.5 9.0
Maximum Mud Weight - Outside (ppg) 9.2 10.5 9.0
Design Cement Top - MD (ft) 0 2700 10750
Design Cement Top - TVD (ft) 0 2700 10700

Max. Hydrostatic Inside w/ Dry Outside (psi) 1435 6552 6552
Casing Burst Rating (psi) 3450 7930 9190
Burst Safety Factor (1.10 Minimum) 2.40 1.21 L40

Max. Hydrostatic Outside w/ Dry Inside (psi) 1435 6552 6552
Collapse Rating 1950 8850 8830
Collapse Safety Factor (1.125 Minimum) 1.36 1.35 1.35

Casing Weight in Air (kips) 204.0 642.0 110.0
Body Yield (kips) 1069 1244 466
Joint Strength (kips) 1140 1414 416
Tension Safety Factor (1.60 Minimum) 5.59 1.94





OXY USA

DAILYOPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: 12/05/2008
Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 71

oppgaTIONR

From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details
Phw OndP Rih Tune

0:00 6:00 6.00 21|NDR DRILL RSS P DRILLFROM 9073' TO 9132' ROP= 9.8 FPH
WOB - 40K; RPM: 90; TQ= 7-11K
UP WT= 320K; DNWT= 305K; RT WT= 325K
SHOCKS & LATVIBS: LEVEL 1

6:00 11:00 5.00 21|NDR DRILL RSS P DRILLFROM 9,132' TO 9,178' OR 46' IN 5 HRS OR 9.3'lHR. FORMATION CHANGE @
9,175'- LIMESTONE - WOB - 38K; RPM -70; 761 GPM @ 182 STKS @ 3,806 PSI,
SHOCKS - 0.0; LATVIB'S - 1-2; ROP - 12.3'lHR. TOOL BEGINNINGTO BUILDANGLE -

1.76 DEGREES.
11:00 13:30 2.50 21INDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 9,178' TO 9,200' OR 22' IN 2.5 HRS OR 8.8'lHR. TAKESURVEY SHOT -

2.15 DEGREES. CONTACT DRLG ENGR & ADVISE. BEGIN BUILDINGSLUG.
13:30 14:00 0.50 21lNDR CIRC CNDFLD P FINISH BUILDINGSLUG & PUMP SAME.

14:00 18:00 4.00 21\NDR TRIP DRILL P POOH TO BHA#8. PULL6 -8K OVER ON 1ST &2ND STD. NO HOLE PROBLEMS ON
TRIP-OUT.

18:00 21:00 3.00 21|NDR TRIP BHA P RACK BACK BHA,BREAKOUT BlT# 8. HOLE TOOK 115 BBLS MUD ON TRIP OUT, 12
BBLS OVER CALCULATED

21:00 0:00 3.00 21INDR BOP TSTBOP P PULLWEAR BUSHING, RUN TEST PLUG, &TEST BOPE 250/5000 PSI

TotilTIPle 24.00

Safety Incident? N Days since Last RI: 58.00 Weather Comments:

Environ Incident7 N Days since Last LTA 58.00 32 DEGREES AMBIENTTEMP; CLEAR;WIND 7 MPH FROM ne; 26 DEGREES WIND CHILL
Incident Comments: FACTOR
No incidents reported last 24 hours.

Other Remarks: NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS.

DIESEL USED: 2,332 GAL. DIESEL ON HAND:13,992 GAL. RECIEVED 4000 GAL

HOLE TOOK 117 BBLS MUD IN LAST 24 HOURS. TOTAL LOSSES FOR SECTION 2084 BBLS

BLM AL McKEE & BERT HEART UPDATED BY EMAILON UPCOMING BOP TEST / POOH FOR BHA#9 @ 15:00 HRS.

12/8/2008 6:57:16PM Page 2 of



soos- on- o CONFIDENTIAL
CONFIDENTIALDAILYOPERATION RTNERREPORT

PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL354 Date: 12l06/2008
Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 72

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINALKB @7,920.00ft DFS: 36.19
Today's MD: 9,237.0 ft Progress: 37.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 9,200.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 3.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PRMD Avn ROP Tndav- 12,3 ft/hr AFF Number- 94370114 AFF ene
Current Formation ARAPIEN SHALE@4,720.0 Lithology: RED BROWN SHALE W/ ORANGE SILTY SAND &ANHYDRITE

(:¡¡rrentqqq- DRILL AHEADWI ROTARY STEERABLE SYSTEM
74-HrFilmmary- TEST BOPE / SLIP &CUT DRILLINGLINE/ TRIP TO BOTTOM/ DRILLAHEAD
94.py apappy DRILLAHEADW/ ROTABY gEEBARLE SYSTEM

Last Casing: 13.375in @2,809ft Str Wt UplDn: 315.0/ 320.0 kit Pump Rate: 753.5 Conn:

Next Opsing: 9.625in @ 9,000ft Str Wt Rot: 315.0 kit Pump Press: 3,750.0 Trip:

Last BOP Press Test: 12/06/2008 Torg Off Btm: 6.0 ft-Ib Backgr:

Form Test/EMW: FIT / 13.03 ppg Torg On Btm: 11.0 ft-Ib

SIIPPrvisor 7- RODNEY MANIACI 9,277,0 1.63 71.99 9,276.52 23.9 -13.0 26.0 1.00 -0.56

Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 9,183.0 2.16 48.06 9,182.57 22.3 -15.6 24.9 1.11 1.06
naninniet- KIRKSPARKMAN 9,090.0 1.17 37.09 9,089.61 20.4 -17,5 23.4 1.07 1.02
Orv Personnal: 0 8,995.0 0.20 72.06 8,994.61 19.6 -18.2 22.7 0.04 0.00
Contractor Personnel 26 8,901.0 0.20 82.62 8,900.62 19.5 -18.5 22.7 0.06 0.01
Total on Site: 26 8 805.0 0.19 98.69 8.804.62 19.5 -18.9 22.8 0.10 -0.05

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MDin MDOut I-O.D-L B-G-O-R

Code
9 12.250 HUGHES CHRISTENS HC505ZX 7009897 M323 7x13 9,200.0
8 12.250 SECURITY DBS FMHX653ZZ 11255966 M323 6x14 7,211.0 9,200.0 1-1-WT-T D-1-NO-DMF

\0 BIT OP RATINGPARAMETERSTK DAŸ
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hra Hra min/may min/max
9 3.00 3.0 37.( 37.0 12. 12.: 15.0/40.0 60/75 0.907 637.( 258.1 2.3

MIIñ DATA .NP MPARK.AVA i ART ni niiMNFMT RHA

Engineer: BILLDESHOTELS/NICK LIGH MBT: 27.5 lbm/bbi BHANo: 9 Bit No: 9 MD In: 9,200.0 ft
Sample From: PIT pH: 10.5 Piirpn<.« DRILLVERTICALHOLE MD r ily
Mud Type: BRINE / POLYMER WBM Pm / Pom: r*nmnnnent on in .ite i onnth
Time I MD: 20:00 / 9,200.0 Pf I Mf: 0.5 / 2.0
Density @Temp: 10,60 / 50 Chlorides: 195,000 PDC BIT 12.25C 3.000 1 1.30

Rheology Temp: 50 Ca+ l K+: / ROTARY STEERABLE MOTOR 8.375 3.200 1 13.76

Viscosity: 55.00 CaCl2: FLOATSUB 8.000 2.875 1 3.12
PV I YP: 17 / 15 Clom: NON-MAGINTEGRALBLADESTABILIZER 12.126 2.500 1 5.14
Gels 10s/10m/30m 4 / 19 / 27 Lime: MWDTOOL 8.50C 2.812 1 29.42
API WL: 12.00 ES: NON-MAGDRILLCOLLAR 8.125 2.937 1 30.78
HTHP WL: ECD: 10.71 NON-MAGINTEGRALBLADESTABILIZER 12.12C 2.812 1 3.75
Cake API I HTHP: 2.0 / nl K: / DRILLCOLLAR 7.875 3.000 5 152.94
Solids / Sol Corr: 4.30 / 4.30 Carbonate:
Oil l Water: / 95.9 Bicarbonate: DRILL COLLAR 7.75C 2.875 5 145.39

Sand: 0.25 Form Loss: / 2.367.0 DRILLCOLLAR 7.437 2.750 1 28.50
Water Added: Fluid Disch: / CROSSOVER 6.625 3.000 7 2.80
011Added: HWDP 5.000 3.000 7 215.34
I AS 4 in i se on nRi\ \ \NG lAR 6.25C 2.500 1 32.03
VG Meter ?@3 / ?@6 / ? 100 / ? 200 , ? 300 / 7 600
Comments: POOH, SLIP/CUT DRILLLINE,CHANGE OUT BHAAND BIT, Total Length: 1,243.92 ft Wt below Jars: 53,229.0 kig
RIH NO PROBLEMS.

Utin pnt niinTR

Product Units Otv Used
ENG24HR#1 1 1.00 RECEIVED
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00

DEC12 2008
DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING

12/8/2008 6:22:39PM Page 1 of



OXYUSA

DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 12/06/2008
Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 72

From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

0:00 4:00 4.00 21|NDR BOP TSTBOP P TEST BOPE 250/5000 PSI, ANNULAR250/3500 PSI.

4:00 4:30 0.50 21|NDR BOP TSTBOP P RIG DOWN BOP TEST EQUIPMENT

4:30 5:00 0.50 21INDR BOP TSTBOP P INSTALLWEAR BUSHING
5:00 8:30 3.50 21INDR RIGMT SRVRIG P SLIP & CUT DRILLINGLINE
8:30 10:00 1.50 21INDR TRIP BHA P TlH W/ BHA#9 AND LAY DOWN TOOLS.

10:00 15:30 5.50 21INDR TRIP BHA P PICK-UP TOOLS AND MAKE-UP.COULD NOT BREAK-OUTMONEL COLLARW/ ST-80.
BREAK-OUTW/ TONGS. CHANGE-OUTMONEL. ST-80 NOT WORKING PROPERLY.
FORCED TO USE TONGS TO TORQUE BHATOOLS. RUN 1 STD HWDP &SHALLOW
TEST TOOL. GOOD TEST.

15:30 20:30 5.00 21|NDR TRIP BHA P TRIP IN HOLE TO 9124'. NO HOLE PROBLEMS.
20:30 21:00 0.50 21|NDR REAM PRRM P WASH & REAMTO BOTTOM. PRECAUTIONARYFAN BOTTOM FOR JUNK.

21:00 0:00 3.00 21|NDR DRILL RSS P DRILLFROM 9200' TO 923T ROP= 12.3 FPH
WOB - 40K; RPM: 75; TQ= 9-11K 745 GPM = 3750 PSI
UP WT= 320K; DNWT= 305K; RT WT= 325K
SPR #1@ 30 SPM= 200 PSI @ 50 SPM = 480 PSI
SPR #3@ 30 SPM= 200 PSI @50 SPM = 440 PSI
SHOCKS & LAT VIBS: LEVEL 1

Tot | e 24.00
Safety Incident? N Days since Last RI: 59.00 Weather Comments:

Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA 59.00 41 DEGREES AMBIENTTEMP; CLEAR;WIND5 MPH FROM SOUTH; 38 DEGREES WIND
Incident Comments: CHILLFACTOR
No incidents reported last 24 hours.

Other Remarks: NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS.

1 SPILL 15 TO 20 BBLS MUD IN CONTAINMENTAROUND MUDPIT.

DIESEL USED: 2831 GAL. DIESEL ON HAND: 13,356 GAL. RECIEVED 40000 GAL

12/8/2008 6:22:41PM Page 2 of
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CONFIDENTIALo 1LYOPERATI N RTNE REP AT
PLATEÅUVALLEYFE0ERAL 35-1 Date: 12/07/2008

Ërim.Reason: 0RIG DRILLVERT USA Report Ne: 73

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINALKB @7,920.00ft DFS: 37.19
Today's MD; 9,800.0 ft Progress: 563.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 9,237.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 22.50 hr AFE MD/Days: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
onun arm ano Torinv- 25.0 ft/hr AFF Niimhar· 94370114 Apr enet-

Current Formation ARAPIENSHALE@4,720.0 Lithology: RED BED BROWN SHALE W/ ORANGE SILTY SAND &

citrrent 009- DRILLAHEADWI ROTARY STEERABLE SYSTEM
74-HrSilmmary- DRILLAHEADWl ROTARY STEERABLE SYSTEM

+NrF"r~r1*t- DRILLAH¶AD W/ ROTARY 3TEERABLESYSTEM
CARINNAÑii enNTÑOÌ ÑOnin AAR R. TORollW ÑYORAlli Inn Miln AAR Avä M

Last Casing: 13.375in @2,809ft Str Wt UplDn: 315.0/ 320.0 kl Pump Rate: 749.3 Conn:

Next Opsjnq: 9.625in @9,000ft Str Wt Rot: 315.0 kif Pump Press: 3,750.0 Trip:

Last BOP Press Test: 12/06/2008 Torg Off Btm: 6,0 ft-Ib Backgr:

Form Test/EMW: FIT /13.03 PÞ9 Torg On Btm: 12.0 ft-Ib

PERSONNEL $URVEY DATA0.A4
Simervisnr 1: DUB CAMERON Mn inni A V6 l¾ S I.iÀ I
Simarvinnr 2: RODNEYMANIACI 9,848.0 0.29 97.59 9,847.46 25.1 -6.1 25.8 0.30 -0.29

Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 9,753.0 0.57 90.24 9,752.46 25.1 -6.8 26.0 0.76 -0.72

nanioniet· KIRKSPARKMAN 9,658.0 1.25 73.01 9,657.48 24.8 -8.3 26.0 0.71 0.71
Oxv Personnet 0 9,562.0 0.57 77.49 9,561.49 24.4 -9.8 25.8 0.52 0.48
Contractor Personnel 25 9,467.0 0.11 119.44 9,466.49 24.4 -10.3 25.9 0.76 -0.74

Total on Site: 25 9.372.0 0.81 86.36 9,371.49 24.4 -11.1 26.0 0.91 -0.86

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MDIn MDOut 1-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
9 12.250 HUGHES CHRISTENS HC505ZX 7009897 M323 7x13 9,200.0 -- - -

I
BIT OPFRATING PA AMETERSTr DAY

Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI
Hra Hra min/max min/max

9 22.50 25.50 653. 690. 29.C 27. 15.0/40.0 60/75 0,907 654.x 265.2 2.4

Miln BATA - MF MPARK.AVA i ARTfiR CURRFMT ANA

Engineer: BILLDESHOTELSINICKLIGH MBT: BHANo: 9 Bit No: 9 MD In: 9,200.0 ft
Sample From: OUT pH: 10.3 Piirnose DRILLVERTICALHOLE MD Di t
Mud Type: BRINE/ POLYMER WBM Pm / Pom: Comnnnant on in .ite i annth
Time I MD: 18:00 / 9,683.0 Pf I Mf: 0.5 / 1.8
Density @ Temp: 10.60 / 178 Chlorldes: 190,000 PDC BIT 12.25C 3.000 1 1.30

Rheology Temp: 165 Ca+ l K+: / ROTARYSTEERABLE MOTOR 8.375 3.200 1 13.76

Viscosity: 56.00 CaCl2: FLOATSUB 8.00C 2.875 1 3.12
PV IYP: 18 / 16 Clom: NON-MAGINTEGRALBLADESTABILIZER 12.126 2.500 1 5.14
Gels 10s/10m/30m 5 / 19 / 25 Lime: MWDTOOL 8.50C 2.812 1 29,42
API WL: 12.00 ES: NON-MAGDRILLCOLLAR 8.125 2.937 1 30,78
HTHP WL: ECD: 10.71 NON-MAGINTEGRALBLADESTABILIZER 12.12C 2.812 1 3.75
Cake API / HTHP: 2.0 / nl K: / DRILLCOLLAR 7.875 3.000 5 152.94
Solids / Sol Corr: 3.80 / 3.80 Carbonate: DRILLCOLLAR 7.75C 2.875 5 145.39Oil I Water: / 96.2 Bicarbonate:
Sand: 0.25 Form Loss: 120.0 / 2,487.0 DRILLCOLLAR 7.437 2.750 1 28.50

Water Added: Fluid Disch: / CROSSOVER 6.625 3.000 7 2.80
Oli Added: HWDP 5.000 3.000 7 215.34
i GS 3 80 / 34 47 DRil I ING , IAR 6.25C 2.500 1 32.03
VG MPter- 3@3 / 4®6 / 17@100 / 23@200 / 34@300 / 528,600
Comments: ADDED2% BIODIESEL, NO EFFECT ON FOAMINGISSUES. Total Length: 1,243.92 ft Wt below ,Iars: 53,229.0 kig
DUMPED SAND TRAPS ON CONNECTIONS AS NEEDED. HIT A TIGHT SPOT
AT 9685 AND WORKED THE PIPE THROUGH IT. CURRENTLY DRILLING

Miln PRf niICTR

Product Units Otv Useri
AQUABLOC 50 LB/SX 40.00 AECEIVED
CAUSTIC SODA 50 LBISX 20.00
DIALD25 5 GAL/CN 2.00
ENG24HR#1 1 1.00 DECi 2 2008
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00
FINNFIX(CMC-LV) 50 LBSISK 100,00
FLOW-ZAN 25 LB SX 25.00 ÛË-
LIME 50 LBlŠX 10.00
MICAFINE 50 LBlŠX 10.00
NOFOAM X 5 GAL/CN 10.00
SEA MUD 50 LBS/SK 110.00
SODA ASH 50 LBS/SK 4.00
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OXY USA

DAILYOPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 12/07/2008
Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 73

OPPPATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

PM- Onde mih Tore
0:00 3:00 3.00 21INDR DRILL RSS P DRILLFROM 923T TO 931T ROP= 26.6 FPH

WOB - 40K; RPM: 75; TQ= 9-11K 750 GPM = 3750 PSI
UP WT= 320K; DN WT= 305K; RT WT= 325K
SHOCKS &LAT VIBS: LEVEL 1

3:00 3:30 0.50 21\NDR RIGMT SRVRIG P SERVICE RIG

3:30 6:00 2.50 21|NDR DRILL RSS P DRILLFROM 9317' TO 9385' ROP= 28.3 FPH

WOB - 40K; RPM: 75; TQ= 9-11K 750 GPM = 3750 PSI
UP WT= 320K; DNWT= 305K; RT WT= 325K
SHOCKS & LATVIBS: LEVEL 1

6:00 15:00 9.00 21lNDR DRILL RSS P DRILLFROM 9,385' TO 9,603' OR 218' IN 9 HRS OR 24.2'lHR. WOB - 42K; RPM - 75;
SHOCKS -0.3; LATVlB'S - LEVEL1. SURFACE TORQUE -7.

15:00 15:30 0.50 211NDR RIGMT REP PT REPAIR OILER LINES FOR ROTATINGHEAD. MAINTAIN20 -30 PSI.

15:30 18:00 2.50 21|NDR DRILL RSS P DRILLFROM 9,603' TO 9,680'or 7T IN 2.5 HRS OR 30.8'lHR. SHOCKS -0.0; LATVIB'S
- LEVEL 1. DUMP SAND TRAP ON EA. CONNECTION; FERMENTATIONODOR
SUBSIDING.WOB-41K;RPM-80.

18:00 20:00 2.00 21INDR DRILL RSS P DRILLFROM 9680' TO 9719' ROP= 20 FPH
WOB - 38K; RPM: 75; TQ= 9-10K 750 GPM = 3750 PSI
UP WT= 320K; DN WT= 305K; RT WT= 325K
SHOCKS &LAT VIBS: LEVEL 1

20:00 20:30 0.50 21INDR CIRC CNDFLD PT TREAT ACTIVE SYSTEM, ADD MUDAND STRING IN BRINE INTHE SUCTION PIT TO
CONTROL EXCESSIVE FOAM. REPRIME MUD PUMPS. FERMENTATION ODOR STRONG

20:30 0:00 3.50 21\NDR DRILL RSS P DRILLFROM 9719' TO 9800' ROP= 23 FPH
WOB - 40K; RPM: 75; TQ= 9-10K 750 GPM = 3750 PSI
UP WT= 320K; DN WT= 305K; RT WT= 325K
SHOCKS &LAT VIBS: LEVEL 1

Tob| \pe 24.00

Safety incident? N Days since Last RI: 60.00 Weather Comments:

Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA 60.00 30 DEGREES AMB\ENTTEMP; CLOUDY;WIND5 MPH FROM NORTH; 25 DEGREES WIND
Incident Comments: CHILLFACTOR
No incidents reported last 24 hours.

Other Remarks: NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS.

GETTING LARGE PIECES OF WOOD,ROCKS &COTTON FIBRE'S IN DP SCREENS. BY ELIMINATION,DISCOVER IT'S COMING
FROM BRINE STORAGE.
WILLRUN BRINE OVER SHAKERS FROM NOW ON. WILL INSTALLFILTER SYSTEM IF NECESSARY @TRANSFER PUMP.
CONTINUE TO WORK ON CLEAN-UP THROUGHOUT MORN. TWR.

HOLE TOOK 120 BBLS MUD IN LAST 24 HOURS. TOTALLOSSES FOR SECTION 2077 BBLS
DIESEL USED: 3392 GAL. DIESEL ON HAND:11236 GAL.
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CONFIDENTIALDAILYO ERATIO ARTNER REPORT
PLATEAUVALLEY FEDERAL35-1 Date: 12/08/2008

Prim Reason:ORIG DRILL VERÌ USA Report No: 74

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB @7,920.00ftDFS: 38.19
Today's MD: 10,168.0 ft Progress: 368.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 9,800.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 23.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 16.0 ftlhr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: ARAPIEN SHALE@4,720.0 Lithology: 80% ANHYDRITE, LIMESTONE
Current Ops: DRILL AHEAD W/ ROTARY STEERABLE SYSTEM
24-Hr Summary: DRILL AHEAD WI ROTARY STEERABLE SYSTEM
24-Hr Forecast: DRILL AHEAD W/ ROTAI Y STEERABLE SYSTEM

CASINGIWELLCONTROL HOOKLOAD& TOROUE HYORAULICS MUD GAS Avg Máx
Last Casing: 13.375in @2,809ft Str Wt UplDn: 315.0/ 320.0 kip Pump Rate: 753.5 Conn:
Next Casing: 9.625in @ 9,000ft Str Wt Rot: 315.0 kip Pump Press: 3,580.0 Trip:
Last BOP Press Test: 12/06/2008 Torq Off Btm: 6.0 ft-Ibt Backgr:
Form TestlEMW: FIT / 13.03 ppg Torq On Btm: 12.0 ft-tbt

PRRSONNEl SURVEY DATA (L AST6)
Supervisor 1: DUB CAMERON MD Incl Azi TVD NI-S El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2: RODNEY MANIACI 10,136.0 0.37 97.28 10,134.44 26.6 -2./ 26.6 0.40 -0.37

Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 10,040.0 0.72 81.70 10,039.44 25.6 -3.6 25.8 0.35 -0.34

Geologist: KIRK SPARKMAN 9,944.0 1.05 76.81 9,943.46 25.3 -5.0 25.8 0.82 0.79
Oxy Personnel: 0 9,848.0 0.29 97.69 9,847.46 25.1 -6.1 25.8 0.30 -0.29

Contractor Personnel: 24
. , .46 . X . . 6

Total on Site: 24

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
9 12.250 HUGHES CHRISTE HC505ZX 7009897 M323 7x13 9,200.0 - - - -

ITOPERATINGÞARAsiETERS TOOAY
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max
9 23.00 48.50 368.( 1,068.0 16.0 21.E 20.0/45.0 60/100 0.907 654A 265.2 2.4

MUD DATA NENPARK-AVA LAST ÔR CURRENTBHA
Engineer: BILL DESHOTELS/NICK LR MBT: 25.0 lbm/bbl BHA No: 9 Bit No: 9 MD In: 9,200.0 ft
Sample From: OUT pH: 10.4 Pur ose: DRILL VERTICAL HOLE MD Out:
Mud Type: BRINE / POLYMER WBM Pm / Pom:
Time / MD: 22:00 / 10,167.0 Pf I Mf: 0.5 / 1.7 Component OD ID Jts Len¶th

Density @Temp: 10.50 / 170 Chlorides: 185,000 'DC BIT 12.250 3.000 1 1.30

Rheology Temp: 165 Ca+ / K+: / 2OTARYSTEERABLE MOTOR 8.375 3.200 1 13.76
Viscosity: 64.00 CaCl2: ¯LOAT SUB 8.000 2.875 1 3.12
PV I YP: 18 / 15 Clom: MON-MAGINTEGRAL BLADE STABILl2 12.125 2.500 1 5.14
Gels 10s/10m/30m:6 / 22 / 30 Lime: VIWDTOOL 8.500 2.812 1 29.42
API WL: 10.50 ES: 90N-MAG DRILL COLLAR 8.125 2.937 1 30.78
HTHP WL: ECD: 10.71 MON-MAGINTEGRAL BLADE STABILl2 12.120 2.812 1 3.75
Cake API / HTHP: 2.0 / n / K /
Solids / Sol Corr: 4.20 / 4.20 Carbonate: )RILL COLLAR 7.875 3.000 5 152.94
Oil / Water: / 95.8 Bicarbonate: JRILLCOLLAR 7.750 2.875 5 145.39

Sand: 0.25 Form Loss: 53.0 / 2,552.0 )RILL COLLAR 7.437 2.750 1 28.50
Water Added: Fluid Disch: / 3ROSSOVER 6.625 3.000 7 2.80
Oil Added: lWDP 5.000 3.000 7 215.34
LGS: 4.20 / 38.09 )RILLINGJAR 6.250 2.500 1 32.03
VG Meter: 3@3 / 4@6 / 15@100 / 25(ö·200 / 33@300 / 51@600
Comments: DRILLING AHEAD. ENDURINGFOAMINGCONDITION$ Total Length: 1,243.92 ft Wt below Jars: 53,229.0 kip
IN MIDDLE PITS. INORDER TO LOWER VOLUME, DUMPED MUD AT
SAND TRAPS AND LATER BUILT BACK WITHRESERVE MUD AND
BRINE.ONE OF 3 SHALE SHAKERS DOWN 2 DAYS, WAIT ON

MUDPlK DUCTS
Product Units Qty Used RECElVED

AQUABLOC 50 LBISX 20.00
BUSAN 40 LBlŠX 2.00 DECi 2 2008CAUSTIC SODA 50 LB/SX 20.00
ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENNGNF

X
CRM

-LV) 50 LBS/SK i
0 DIVOFOlLGAS&MINING

FLOW-ZAN 25 LB SX 25.00
LIME 50 LB/SX 10.00
MICA FINE 50 LB/SX 10.00
NEW CARB 50 LB/SX 10.00
NEWEASE 203 5 GAL/CN 21.00
NOFOAM A 5 GAL/CN 32.00
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OXYUSA
DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT

Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEY FEDERAL 35-1 Date: 12/08/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILL VERT USA Report No: 74

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 3:00 3.00 21|NDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 9800' TO 9890' ROP= 30 FPH

WOB - 40K; RPM: 75; TQ= 9-12K 750 GPM = 3750 PSI
UP WT= 340K; DN WT= 335K; RT WT= 337K
SHOCKS & LAT VIBS: LEVEL 1

3:00 3:30 0.50 21|NDR RIGMT REP P SERVICE RIG
3:30 6:00 2.50 21|NDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 9890' TO 9985' ROP= 38 FPH

WOB - 40K; RPM: 75; TQ= 9-12K 750 GPM = 3750 PSI
UP WT= 335K; DN WT= 330K; RT WT= 340K
SPR #1@ 30 SPM= 180 PSI @50 SPM = 400 PSI
SPR #3@ 30 SPM= 180 PSI @50 SPM = 420 PSI
SHOCKS & LAT VIBS: LEVEL 1

6:00 18:00 12.00 21|NDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 9,985' TO 10,158' OR 173' IN 12 HRS OR 14.5'lHR. DRILLED OFF INTO
ANHYDRITE. ROP - S'lHR. WOB - 31K; RPM - 67; LAT VlB'S - 1; SHOCKS - 0; STICK -

100-300 %. CHANGING DRLG PARA TO DRILL TO MITIGATESTICK. PUMP 746
GPM @ 179 STKS @ 3,663 PSI.

18:00 21:00 3.00 21|NDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 10,158' TO 10,165' ROP= 2 FPH
WOB - 40K; RPM: 75; TQ= 9-12K 750 GPM = 3750 PSI
UP WT= 335K; DN WT= 330K; RT WT= 340K
SHOCKS & LAT VIBS: LEVEL 1

21:00 21:30 0.50 21INDR CIRC CNDFLD P TREAT ACTIVE SYSTEM, BUILD MUD AND STRING IN BRINE IN THE SUCTION PIT
TO CONTROL EXCESSIVE FOAM. REPRIME MUDPUMPS.

21:30 0:00 2.50 21INDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 10,165' TO 10,168' ROP= 1.2 FPH
DISCUSSED WITH DRILLINGENGINEER OF REDUCED BIT PERFORMANCE AND
DIFFICULTIES
WOB - 40K; RPM: 75; TQ= S-8K 750 GPM = 3750 PSI
UP WT= 340K; DN WT= 350K; RT WT= 350K
SHOCKS & LAT VIBS: LEVEL1; STICK SLIP 100 - 300%

Total Time 24.0C
Safety inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 61.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident7 N Days since Last LTA: 61.00 13 DEGREES AMBIENT TEMP; CLEAR; WIND 7 MPH FROM NNE; 3 DEGREES WIND
Incident Comments: UHILL FACTOR

No incidents reported last 24 hours.

Other Remarks: NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS.

HOLE TOOK 53 BBLS MUD IN LAST 24 HOURS. TOTAL LOSSES FOR SECTION 2130 BBLS
DIESEL USED: 3816 GAL. DIESEL ON HAND: 11,660 GAL.
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CONFIDENTIALDAILY
OPERATIONSUSAARTNER

REPORT
PLATEAU VALLEY FEDERAL 35-1 Date: 12/09/2008

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILL VERT USA Report No: 75

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB @7,920.00ft DFS: 39.19
Today's MD: 10,212.0 ft Progress: 44.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 10,168.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 23.50 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 1.9 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: ARAPIEN SHALE@4,720.0 Lithology:80% ANHYDRITE, SHALE WI SILTY SAND

Current Ops: DRILL AHEAD W/ ROTARY STEERABLE SYSTEM
24-Hr Summary: DRILL AHEADW/ ROTARY STEERABLE SYSTEM
24-Hr Forecast: DRILL AHEAD W/ ROTAF Y STEERABLE SYSTEM

CASINGlWELL CONTROL HOOKLOAD & TOROUE HYDRAULICS MUD GAS Ava Max
Last Casing: 13.375\n @2,809ft Str Wt UplDn: 340.0/ 350.0 kip Pump Rate: 753.5 onn:
Next Casing: 9.625in @ 9,000ft Str Wt Rot: 350.0 kip Pump Press: 3,450.0 rip:
Last BOP Press Test: 12/06/2008 Torq Off Btm: 6.0 ft-Ibi ackgr:
Form Test/EMW: FIT/ 13.03 ppg Torq On Btm: 12.0 ft-Ibf

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA (LAST 6)
Supervisor 1: WADE FRAME MD Inci Azi TVD N/-S El-W VS DLS Bulld
Supervisor 2: RODNEY MANIACI 10,135.0 0.37 97.28 10,134.44 2b.6 -2./ 26.6 0.40 -0.3/

Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 10,040.0 0.72 81.70 10,039.44 25.6 -3.6 25.8 0.35 -0.34

Geologist: KIRK SPARKMAN 9,944.0 1.05 76.81 9,943.45 25.3 -5.0 25.8 0.82 0./9
Oxy Personnel: 0 9,848.0 0.29 97.59 9,847.46 25.1 -6.1 26.8 0.30 -0.29

Contractor Personnel: 24
.

Total on Site: 24

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
9 12.250 HUGHES CHRISTE HC505ZX 7009897 M323 7x13 9,200.0 -- - -

BIT OPERATINGPARAMETERSTODAY
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Nor Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

MUDDATA- NE NPARK-AVA LAST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: SCOTT JONES/NICK LIGH MBT: 15.0 lbm/bbl BHA No: 9 Bit No: 9 MD In: 9,200.0 ft
Sample From: OUT pH: 11.4 Purpose: DRILL VERTICAL HOLE MD Out:
Mud Type: BRINE / POLYMER WBM Pm / Pom:
Time / MD: 3:00 / 10,217.0 Pf I Mf: 0.3 / 1.2 Component OD ID Jts Length

Density @Temp: 10.10 / 175 Chlorides: 152,000 'DC BIT 12.250 3.000 1 1.30
Rheology Temp: 175 Ca+ l K+: I IOTARY STEERABLE MOTOR 8.375 3.200 1 13.76
Viscosity: 52.00 CaCl2: LOAT SUB 8.000 2.87b 1 3.12
PV I YP: 11 / 11 Clom: MON-MAG INTEGRAL BLADE STABILI2 12.125 2.500 1 5.14
Gels 10s/10m/30m:3 / 13 / 18 Lime: VlWDTOOL 8.500 2.812 1 29.42
API WL: 13.40 ES: MON-MAG DRILL COLLAR 8.125 2.93/ 1 30.78
HTHP WL: ECD: 10.20 10N-MAG INTEGRAL BLADE STABILI2 12.120 2.812 1 3.7b
Cake API / HTHP· 2.0 / n / K / 3RILL COLLAR 7.875 3.000 5 152.94Solid Seol Corr: 16 00 / 3.20 crabrbnana

e:
Sand: 0.25 Form Loss: 3.0 / 2,555.0 )RILL COLLAR 7.437 2.750 1 28.50
Water Added: Fluid Disch: / ROSSOVER 6.625 3.000 7 2.80
Oil Added: IWDP 6.000 3.000 / 216.34
LGS: 3.20 /29.02 )RILLINGJAR 6.250 2.500 1 32.03
VG Meter: 2@3 / 3@6 / 11@100 / 16 200 / 22@300 / 33@600
Comments: IN ORDER TO COMBAl NOAM,wA IERED BACK WITH Total Length: 1,243.92 ft Wt below Jars: 53,229.0 kip
BRINE AND RAN PEANUT PUMP AT THE FLOW LINE TO CONTINUE
REMOVING FOAM HEAD.LOWERED SHAKERS TO RUN FOAM OVER.
USING FRESH WATER AND NEWGEL TO BUILD 100 BBL HIGH VIS

MUD PRC DUCTS
Product Units Qty Used RECEIVED

BUSAN 40 LBlŠX 4.00
CAUSTICSODA 50 LBlŠX 5.00 DECi 2 2008
ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00
FLOW-ZAN 25 LB SX 15.00 0 30 MS &MINING
LIME 50 LB/SX 15.00
MICA FINE 50 LB/SX 15.00
SODA ASH 50 LBS/SK 4.00
TAX EACH 1.00
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OXY USA

DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: 12/09/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILL VERT USA Report No: 75

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 3:30 3.50 21lNDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 10,168' TO 10,173' ROP= 1.4 FPH

WOB - 40K; RPM: 75; TQ= 9-12K 750 GPM = 3650 PSI
UP WT= 340K; DN WT= 350K; RT WT= 350K
SHOCKS & LATVIBS:>LEVEL 1

3:30 4:00 0.50 21|NDR RIGMT SRVRIG P SERVICE RIG
4:00 6:00 2.00 21lNDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 10,173' TO 10,176' ROP= 1.5 FPH

DRILL AHEAD AS PER DRILLING ENGINEER
WOB - 40K; RPM: 75; TQ= 9-12K 750 GPM = 3651 PSI
UP WT= 340K; DN WT= 350K; RT WT= 350K
SPR #1@ 30 SPM= 160 PSI @ 50 SPM = 378 PSI
SPR #3@ 30 SPM= 160 PSI @ 50 SPM = 380 PSI
SHOCKS & LATVIBS:>LEVEL 1

6:00 10:00 4.00 21\NDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 10,176 TO 10,180'. EXPERIENCING LEVEL # 3 SHOCKS. ADJUST BIT
WT TO 40K; RPM -70. CONTINUE TO DRILL AHEAD W/ ADJUSTMENTS FOR ROP.
CONTACT DRLGENGR AND ADVISE.

10:00 18:00 8.00 21|NDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 10,180' TO 10,198' ROP= 1.1 FPH
WOB - 50K; RPM: 75; TQ= 9-13K 750 GPM = 3651 PSI
UP WT= 340K; DN WT= 350K; RT WT= 350K
SHOCKS & LATVIBS:>LEVEL 1

18:00 0:00 6.00 21|NDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 10,198' TO 10,212' ROP= 2.1 FPH
WOB - 50K; RPM: 75; TQ= 4-5K 750 GPM = 3651 PSI
UP WT= 340K; DN WT= 350K; RT WT= 350K
SHOCKS & LAT VIBS:>LEVEL 1

Total Fime 24.0C
Safety inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 62.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 62.00 29 DEGREES AMBIENT TEMP; CLEAR; WIND 9 MPH FROM NE; 21 DEGREES WIND

Incident Comments: UHILL FACTOR

No incidents reported last 24 hours.

Other Remarks: NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS.

HOLE TOOK 3 BBLS MUD IN LAST 24 HOURS. TOTAL LOSSES FOR SECTION 2133 BBLS
DIESEL USED: 3,604 GAL. DIESEL ON HAND: 12,296 GAL.
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CONFIDENTIALDAILY OPERATIONS ARTNER REPORT
PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: 12/10/2008

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 76

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB @7,920.00ft DFS: 40.19
Today's MD: 10,222.0 ft Progress: 10.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 10,212.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 14.25 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 0.7 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: ARAPIENSHALE@4,720.0 Lithology: 80% ANHYDRITE,SHALE WI SILTY SAND
Current Ops: TRIP FOR BIT
24-Hr Summary: DRILL AHEAD W/ ROTARYSTEERABLE SYSTEM / TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT
24-Hr Forecast: TRIP TO BOTTOM/ DRIL AHEAD W/ ROTARY STEERABLE SYSTEM

CASINGlWELL CONTROL HOOKLOAD & TOROUE HYDRAULICS MUDGAS Avg Max
Last Casing: 13.375in @2,809ft Str Wt UplDn: 340.0/ 350.0 kip Pump Rate: 753.5 Conn:
Next Casing: 9.625\n @ 9,000ft Str Wt Rot: 350.0 kipPump Press: 3,130.0 Trip:
Last BOP Press Test: 12/06/2008 Torq Off Btm: 6.0 ft-Ibt Backgr:
Form Test/EMW: FIT/ 13.03 ppg Torq On Btm: 12.0 ft-Ibt

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA(LAST6)
Supervisor 1: WADE FRAME MD Incl Azl TVD NI-S El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2: RODNEY MANIACI 10,184.0 0.20 106.73 10,183.44 26.6 -2.4 26.6 0.36 -0.36

Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 10,135.0 0.37 97.28 10,134.44 25.6 -2.7 25.6 0.40 -0.37

Geologist: KIRK SPARKMAN 10.040.0 0.72 81.70 10,039.44 26.6 -3.6 26.8 0.3b -0.34

Oxy Personnel: 0
, .

-

Contractor Personnel: 24
Total on Site: 24

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No lADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
9 12.250 HUGHES CHRISTE HC505ZX 7009897 M323 7x13 9,200.0 10,222.0 8-8-CR-M D-I-BT-PR

MUDDATA - NE VPARK-AVA LASTOR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: Scott Jones / Jason Moore MBT: 15.0 lbm/bbl BHA No: 9 Bit No: 9 MDIn: 9,200.0 ft
Sample From: PIT pH: 10.9 Purpose: DRILLVERTICAL HOLE MD Out: 10 222.0 ft
Mud Type: BRINE / POLYMER WBM Pm / Pom: Com onent OD ID Jts Len th
Time I MD: 0:01 / 10,222.0 Pf I Mf: 0.2 / 1.2
Density @Temp: 10.20 / 115 Chlorides: 142,000 'DC BIT 12.250 3.000 1 1.30

Rheology Temp: 120 Ca+ I K+: /
Viscosity: 46.00 CaCl2:
PV I YP: 7 / 11 Clom: MON-MAG IN1 I-GRALBLADE S IABILlz 12.125 2.500 1 7.48
Gels 10s/10m/30m:2 / 10 / 21 Lime: VlWDTOOL 8.500 2.812 1 30.88
API WL: 12.40 ES: NON-MAGDRILLCOLLAR 8.125 2.937 1 30.78
HTHP WL: ECD: 10.20 NON-MAGINTEGRALBLADE STABIL12 12.120 2.812 1 3.75
Cake API I HTHP: 2.0 / n / K /
Solids / Sol Corr: 4.80 / 4.80 Carbonate: JRILL COLLAR 7.875 3.000 5 152.94

Oil / Water: 0.0 / 84.0 Bicarbonate: )RILL COLLAR 7./50 2.876 5 145.39
Sand: 0.05 Form Loss: 12.0 / 2,567.0 )RILL CULLAR /.43/ 2./60 1 28.b0
Water Added: Fluid Disch: I 3
Oil Added:
LGS: 4.80 / 43.54 3RILLINGJAR 6.250 2.500 1 32.38
VG Meter: 3@3| 4@6 | 9@100 / 12W00 / 18@300 / 2b@600
Comments: WHILEDRILLING, CIRCULAIED AND CONDITIONED Total Length: 1,248.07 ft Wt below Jars: 53,229.0 kip
MUD. EXCESSIVE FOAMINGWAS CONTROLLED BY ADDRESSING
TEMPERATURE STABILITY.WATER HARDNESS, AND WITH
ADDITIONS OF PRE-HYDRATED NEWGEL. EXCESS FOAMWAS ALSO

MUDPR( DUCTS
Product Units Qty Used RECElVED

DYNADET 5 GAL/CAN 1.00
ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00 DEC12 2008ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00
FINNFIX (CMC-LV) 50 LBS/SK 10.00
FLMEW-ZAN 10 00 DNOF01L,GAS&MINING
MICA FINE 50 LBISX 3.00
NEW GEL 100 LBS/SK 142.00
NEWPAC R 50 LB/SX 17.00
NOFOAM X 5 GAL/CN 6.00
SEA MUD 50 LBS/SK 20.00
SODA ASH 50 LBS/SK 15.00
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OXYUSA
DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT

Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: 12/10/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 76

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 0:30 0.50 21|NDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 10,212' TO 10,212' ROP= 0.7 FPH

WOB - 50K; RPM: 75; TQ= 7-9K 750 GPM = 3651 PSI
UP WT= 340K; DN WT= 350K; RT WT= 350K
SHOCKS & LAT VIBS: >LEVEL 1

0:30 1:00 0.50 211NDR CIRC CNDFLD P TREAT ACTIVE SYSTEM, BUILD MUDAND STRING INBRINEINTHE SUCTION PIT
TO CONTROL EXCESSIVE FOAM.REPRIME MUD PUMPS.

1:00 6:00 5.00 21|NDR DRILL RSS P DRILLFROM 10,212' TO 10,220' ROP= 0.7 FPH
WOB - SOK;RPM: 75; TQ= 7-9K 750 GPM = 3270 PSI
UP WT= 340K; DN WT= 350K; RT WT= 350K
SPR #1@ 30 SPM= 160 PSI @50 SPM = 380 PSI
SPR #3@ 30 SPM= 155 PSI @50 SPM = 380 PSI
SHOCKS & LAT VIBS: >LEVEL 1

6:00 6:45 0.75 21|NDR DRILL RSS P DRILLFROM 10,220' TO 10,221' ROP= 1.3 FPH

WOB - 50K; RPM: 75; TQ= 7-9K 750 GPM = 3270 PSI
UP WT= 340K; DNWT= 350K; RT WT= 350K

SHOCKS & LAT VIBS: >LEVEL1
6:45 7:30 0.75 21INDR RIGMT SRVRIG P SERVICE RIG.
7:30 15:30 8.00 21|NDR DRILL RSS P DRILL FROM 10,221' TO 10,222 ROP= 0.1 FPH

WOB - 45K; RPM: 65; TQ= 7-9K 750 GPM = 3274 PSI
UP WT= 340K; DN WT= 350K; RT WT= 350K

SHOCKS & LAT VIBS: >LEVEL3
STICKSLIP > 0

15:30 16:30 1.00 21INDR CIRC CNDHOL P CIRCULATEMUD &CONDITIONHOLE. MONITOR WELL MW=10.4 PPG
16:30 22:30 6.00 21INDR TRIP DRILL P TRIP OUT OF THE HOLE.

HOLE TOOK 129 BBLS DISP, 16 BBLSOVER CALCULATED.
25K - 30K OVERPULL FI7650' TO 7565'

22:30 0:00 1.50 21INDR TRIP BHA P PUMP ON MWD &ATTEMPT TO TEST POWERDRIVE. FOUND CRACK&WASHOUT
INSAVER SUB BELOWMWDCOLLAR.CHANGE OUT MWD.

Total lime 24.0C
Safety Inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 63.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident7 N Days since Last LTA: 63.00 33 DEGREES AMBlENT TEMP; CLEAR;WIND 1 MPH FROM SE; 33 DEGREES WIND
Incident Comments: CHILL FACTOR

No incidents reported last 24 hours. 4 safe work permits
issued. 1 Hot work permit issued.
Other Remarks: DIESEL USED: 2,544 GAL DIESEL ON HAND:13,568 GAL.

NO ACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS.

HOLE TOOK 12 BBLS MUD IN LAST 24 HOURS.
TOTAL LOSSES FOR SECTION 2142 BBLS

THIRD PARTY PERSONAL SIGNED IN = 18
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CONFIDENTIALDAILYOPERATI S
PAARTNER

REPORT
PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: 12/11/2008

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 77

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB @7,920.00ft DFS: 41.19
Today's MD: 10,242.0 ft Progress: 20.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 10,222.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 10.50 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avg ROP Today: 1.9 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: ARAPIEN SHALE@4,720.0 Lithology: 80% ANHYDRITE, SHALE W/ SILTY SAND
Current Ops: TRIP OUT OF THE HOLEFOR WASHOUT
24-Hr Summary: TRIP IN HOLE BHA #10 / DRILL AHEAD / TRIP OUT FOR WASHOUT
24-Hr Forecast: TRIP OUT OF HOLE / RIC UP &WIRELINE LOG OPEN HOLE SECTION.

CASINGlWELLCONTROL HOOKLOAD &TOROUE HYDRAULICS Uli GAS Av Man
Last Casing: 13.375in @2,809ft Str Wt UplDn: 340.0/ 350.0 kip Pump Rate: 753.5 onn:
Next Casinq: 9.625in @9,000ft Str Wt Rot: 3bU.0 kipPump Press: 3,200.0 rip:
Last BOP Press Test: 12/06/2008 Torq Off Stm: 4.0 ft-Ibt ackgr:
Form Test/EMW: FIT / 13.03 ppg Torq On Btm: 8.0 ft-Ibf

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA(LAST 0)
Supervisor 1: WADE FRAME MD Inci Azi TVD NI-$ EIN Va DLS Build
Supervisor 2: RODNEY MANIACI 10,184.0 0.20 106./3 10,183.44 2b.6 -2.4 26.6 0.36 -0.36

Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 10,135.0 0.37 97.28 10,134.44 25.6 -2.7 2b.6 0.40 -0.3/

Geologist: KIRKSPARKMAN 10,040.0 0.72 81.70 10,039.44 25.6 -3.6 2b.8 0.35 -0.34

Oxy Personnel: 0 9,944.0 1.05 76.81 9,943.4b 2b.3 -b.0 26.8 0.82 0./9
Contractor Personnel: 24 """§"$480"
Total on Site: 24

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
RR 8 12.250 SECURITY DBS FMHX653ZX 7009897 M323 6x14 10,222.0

9 12.250 HUGHES CHRISTE HC505ZX 7009897 M323 7x13 9,200.0 10,222.0 8-8-CR-M D-I-BT-PR

MUDDATA- NE VPARK-AVA LAST OR ClíRRENT BHA
Engineer: SCOTT JONES/ JASON MI MBT: 17.5 lbm/bbi BHA No: 10 Bit No: RR 8 MD In: 10,222.0 ft
Sample From: PIT pH: 10.3 Purpose: DRILL VERTICAL HOLE MDOut:
Mud Type: BRINE / POLYMERWBM Pm I Pom:
Time / MD: 0:01 / 10,242.0 Pf I Mf: 0.2 / 1.3 Component OD ID Jts Length
Density @Temp: 10.40 / 139 Chlorides: 165,000 3DC BIT 12.250 3.000 1 1.30
RheologyTemp: 120 Ca+lK+: / XOlARYSIl-t-RABLEMUION 8.3/b 3.200 1 13./6
Viscosity: 40.00 CaCl2:
PV I YP: 10 / 11 Clom: -

Gels 10s/10m/30m:2 / 7 / 11 Lime:
API WL: 12.20 ES: 1
HTHP WL: ECD: 10.50
Cake API / HTHP: 2.0 / n / K: I

z .1

Solids / Sol Corr: 4.80 / 4.80 Carbonate:
Oil / Water: 0.0 / 85.0 Bicarbonate:
Sand: 0.05 Form Loss: 5.0 / 2,572.0
Water Added: Fluid Disch: / 3ROSSOVI-R 6.62b 3.000 / 2.80
Oil Added:
LGS: 4.80 / 43.50
VGMeter: 2 3) 3@6| 9@100 ) 16 00 / 21¾300 / 31MbUU
Comments: ON TOH FOR NEW BI'i, PULLED20-30K OVER FROM Total Length: 1,243.92 ft Wt below Jars: 53,229.0 kip
7650-7565. ON TlH HITLEDGEAT 3903, REAMED TO 3875 ANDTIH
WITH NO PROBLEMS. ADDED PREHYDRATEDGEL TO MAINTAINAND
IMPROVERHEOLOGY. ADDITIONSOF SODA ASH, AQUABLOCAND

MUDPRC DUCTS
Product Units Qty Used RECENED

CAUSTIC SODA 50 LB/SX 6.00
ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00
FLOW-ZAN 25 LB SX 12.00
NEW BAR 100 LB/SX 66.00
NEW GEL 100 LBS/SK 93.00
NEWEDGE 50 LB/SX 50.00
NEWPAC LV 50 LB/SX 3.00
NEWPAC R 50 LBlŠX 16.00
SAWDUST 2000 LBS/SK 15.00
SODA ASH 50 LBS/SK 54.00
TAX EACH 1.00
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OXYUSA
DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT

Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: 12/11/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 77

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 2:30 2.50 211NDR TRIP BHA P CONTINUE CHANGE OUT MWD, &WARN 11 1/2" LOWER STABILIZER.

SHALLOW HOLE TEST POWERDRIVE, CHANGE BIT TO RERUN SECURITY
FMHX653ZX

2:30 9:15 6.75 21|NDR TRIP DRILL P TRIP IN HOLE TO 10,115'
TAKINGWEIGHT AT 3875'. WASH FROM 3875' TO 3930'

CHANGED OUT SMITHHE HYDRAJAR
9:15 10:00 0.75 21|NDR REAM PRRM P WASHANDREAMFROM 10,115' TO 10,222',

50 RPM, 550 GPM, 2720 PSI, 1KWOB.
FAN BOTTOMFOR 15 MIN.

10:00 18:00 8.00 21|NDR DRILL RSS P DRILLFROM 10,222 TO 10,241', 19' ROP= 2.4 FPH

WOB - 42K; RPM: 60; TQ= 2-9K 750 GPM = 3197 PSI
UP WT= 340K; DN WT= 350K; RT WT= 350K
SPR #1@ 30 SPM= 141 PSI @45 SPM = 283 PSI
SPR #2@ 30 SPM= 156 PSI @45 SPM = 297 PSI

SHOCKS & LATVlBS: >LEVEL1
STICK SLIP > 15 RPM

18:00 20:30 2.50 21INDR DRILL RSS P DRILLFROM 10,241' TO 10,242' ROP= 0.4 FPH
WOB - 42K; RPM: 60; TQ= 5-7K 750 GPM = 3080 PSI
UP WT= 340K; DNWT= 350K; RT WT= 350K
SHOCKS & LATVIBS: >LEVEL1

20:30 21:30 1.00 21INDR OTHR OTHER P TROUBLE SHOOT 200 PSI LOST PRESSURE. TEST SURFACE TO 1500 PSI.
MW=10.4 PPG

21:30 0:00 2.50 21INDR TRIP WSHO P TRIP OUT OF THE HOLE.
TIGHT HOLE 40K TO 50K FROM 10,200' TO 10,080'

Total Time 24.00
Safety Inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 64.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 64.00 36 DEGREES AMBIENT TEMP; CLEAR; WIND 4 MPH FROM SOUTH; 33 DEGREES
Incident Comments: YvlND CHILL FACTOR

No incidents reported last 24 hours.
Other Remarks: DIESEL USED: 1,484 GAL. DIESEL ON lAND: 15,052 GAL.RECD 4000 GALLONS.

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS.

HOLETOOK 5 BBLS MUDIN LAST24 HOURS.
TOTAL LOSSES FOR SECTION 2147 BBLS

THIRD PARTYPERSONAL SIGNED IN = 10

12/12/2008 10:10:58AM Page 2 of



CONFIDENTIALDAIL¥
OPERATIOoN

ARTNER REPORT
PLATEAU VALLEY FEDERAL35-1 Date: 12/12/2008

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 78

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS797 Ref Datum: ORIGINALKB@7,920.00ftDFS: 42.19
Today's MD: 10,243.0 ft Progress: 0.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 10,243.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 0.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Ava ROP Today: 0.0 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: ARAPIENSHALE@4,720.0 Lithology: 80% ANHYDRITE,SHALEW/ SILTYSAND
Current Ops: WIRELINGLOG OPEN HOLESECTION
24-Hr Summary: TRIP OUT OF HOLE/ WIRELINGLOG OPEN HOLESECTION
24-Hr Forecast: WIRELINGLOG OPEN HALESECTION

CASINGIWELLCONTROL HOOKLOAD & TORQUE HYDRAULICS MUD GAS Avp Max
Last Casing: 13.375ln @2,809ft Str Wt UplDn: / Pump Rate: 0.0 Conn:
Next Casing: 9.625ln @9,000ft Str WiÑoi: Pump Press: 0.0 Trip:
Last BOP Press Test: 12/06/2008 Torq Off Btm: Backgr:
Form Test/EMW: FIT/ 13.03 ppg Torq On Btm:

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA (LAST 6)

Supervisor1:WADEFRAME MD Inci Azi TVDNI-SEl-WVS DLSBund
Supervisor 2: RODNEY MANIACI 10,184.0 0.20 106.73 10,183.44 25.6 -2.4 25.6 0.36 -0.36

10,135.0 0.37 97.28 10,134.44 25.6 -2.7 25.6 0.40 -0.37

Oxy Personnel: 0 , . . . , 4 . .

-

Contractor Personnel: 24 , . . . , .4 .

-

. . .

-

Total on Site: 24

BIT RECORD
Blt No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MDOut I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
RR 8 12.250 SECURITY DBS FMHX653ZX 11255966 M323 6x14 10,222.0 10,243.0 3-1-CT-N D-1-WT-WO

9 12.250 HUGHES CHRISTE HC505ZX 7009897 M323 7x13 9,200.0 10,222.0 8-8-CR-M D-1-BT-PR

BIT OPERATING PARAMETERSTODAY
BIt No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

MUÐDATA - NE VPARK-AVA LAST OR CURRENT BMA
Engineer: SCOTT JONES / JASON MI MBT: 17.5 lbm/bbl BHANo: 10 BItNo: RR 8 MDIn: 10,222.0 ft
Sample From: PIT pH: 10.5 Pu ose: DRILLVERTICALHOLE MDOut: 10 243.0 ft
Mud Type: BRINE/ POLYMERWBM Pm I Pom:

rp

Time I MD: 0:01 / 10,242.0 Pf I Mf: 0.3 / 1.5 Com onent OD ID Jts Len th
Density @Temp: 10.45 / 90 Chlorides: 185,000 3DCBIT 12.250 3.000 1 1.30
Rheology Temp: 120 Ca+ l K+: / T TR . 3.2
Viscosity: 50.00 CaCl2: -

. .8 . 2
PV I YP: 13 / 12 Clom: - A N G L z . 2. O
Gels 10s/10m/30m:4 / 7 I 10 Lime: vlWDTOOL 8.500 2.812 1 29.42
API WL: 11.20 ES: - 2
HTHP WL: ECD: 10.50
CakeAPilHTHP: 2.0/ n/K: I
Solids I Sol Corr: 3.70 / 3.70 Carbonate: J I L O A .8 . O 5 52.94
011/ Water: 0.0 / 85.0 Bicarbonate: 3 L

Sand: 0.05 Form Loss: 8.0 / 2,580.0 3 I L L R . 37 . 8.50
Water Added: Fluid Disch: I - 6. 25 . 0 7 . O
Oil Added:
LGS: 3.70 / 33.50 3R L I . 50 2.
VG Meter: 3@3 / 4@6 / 12@i00/ 16¢ 200 / 25@300 / 38W600
Comments: \ÁfDRKEDTIGHTHOLI FROM 40,175-10,062FT. TOH- Total Length: 1,243.92 ft Wt below Jars: 53,229.0 kip
FOUND CRACK IN DRILLCOLLAR.LAYDOWN8" DRILLCOLLARS.
CIRCULATED AND CONDITIONEDMUDWHILECONTINUINGFOAM
REMOVAL.RIGGED UP FOR LOGGINGOPERATIONS. CURRENTLY

MUÐPRt DUCTS
Product Units Oty Used

ENG 24 HR#1 1 1.00 RECEIVED
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00
NEW GEL 100 LBS/SK 13.00
NEWEDGE 50 LB/SX 20.00 -

NEWPAC R 50 LB/SX 19.00
NOLFLOEAMX 5 GEAUCN 48 00 DEOFOLGAS&MUNG
SAWDUST 2000 LBS/SK 10.00
SHRINKWRAP EA. 44.00
SODA ASH 50 LBS/SK 8.00
TAX EACH 1.00
TRUCKINGSERVICE EACH 1.00
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OXYUSA

DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 12/12/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 78

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 6:00 6.00 21INDR TRIP WSHO P TRIP OUT OF HOLE,CHECKTOOLS
6:00 9:30 3.50 21INDR TRIP BHA P STANDBACKTWO STANDS OF 8" DRILLCOLLARS.CRACK/ WASHOUT FOUND

AT THE BOTTOMOF STAND #2 AND THE TOP OF STAND#3.
LAYDOWNREMAINING8" DRILLCOLLARSANDDIRECTIONALTOOLS.

9:30 13:00 3.50 21|NDR TRIP BHA P LAYDOWN8" DRILLCOLLARS FROM DERRICK.CLEARFLOOR OF 12 1/4"TOOLS.
13:00 13:30 0.50 21lNDR SAFE PJSM P PRE JOB SAFETYMEETINGWITH DRESSER ATLASE - LINEPERSONAL.
13:30 14:00 0.50 21\NDR LOG RIGUP P RIG UP DRESSER ATLASEQUIPMENT.
14:00 15:30 1.50 21INDR LOG OHLOG P MAKE UP DLL,DAL,ZD, GM, AND GAMMATOOLS.
15:30 23:00 7.50 21INDR LOG OHLOG P RUN INTHE HOLEWITHATLAS E-LINETOOLS.

WORKTHROUGHTIGHTSPOT @3945', TAG UP @10,220' @LOG UP TO 13 3/8"
CASINGSHOE.

GAMMAHAD A GAP FROM 6500' TO 6100'. WILLRERUN GAMMAON CALIPER
RUN.

HOLETOOK 8 BBLSMUDON THIS RUN.
23:00 0:00 1.00 21|NDR LOG RIGUP P LAYDOWNLOGGINGTOOLS

Total Time 24.00
Safety Inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 65.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 65.00 48 DEGREES AMBIENTTEMP; CLOUDYOVERCAST 11,000'; WIND12 MPH FROM
Incident Comments: SSW; 45 DEGREES WINDCHILLFACTOR
No Incidents reported last 24 hours. 3 safe work permits
issued.
Other Remarks: DIESEL USED: 2,120 GAL.DIESEL ON HAND:17,172 GAL.RECD 4000 GALLONS.

NO ACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS.

HOLE TOOK 8 BBLS MUDINLAST24 HOURS.
TOTAL LOSSES FOR SECTION 2155 BBLS

THIRD PARTYPERSONAL SIGNED IN = 3
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CONFIDENTIALDAILY OPERATION ARTNER REPORT
PLATEAUVALLEY FEDERAL 35-1: Date: 12/13/2008

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILL VERT USA Report No: 79

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS797 Ref Datum: ORIGINALKB@7,920.00ft DFS: 43.19
Today's MD: 10,243.0 ft Progress: 0.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 10,243.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 0.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Ava ROP Today: 0.0 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: ARAPIENSHALE@4,720.0 Lithology:
Current Ops: WIRELINGLOG OPEN HOLESECTION
24-Hr Summary: WIRELINGLOG OPEN HOLESECTION
24-Hr Forecast: WIRELINGLOG OPEN H·3LESECTION / MAKEA CLEANOUT RUNWITH 12 1/4" BIT

CASINGIWELL CONTROL MOOKLOAD &TOROUE HYDRAULICS MUD GAS Ava Max
Last Casing: 13.375ln @2,809ft Str Wt UplDn: / Pump Rate: 0.0 onn:
Next Casing: 9.625In @9,000ft ŠtrWt Rot: Pump Press: 0.0 rip:
Last BOP Press Test: 12/06/2008 Torq Off Btm: ackgr:
Form Test/EMW: FIT) 13.03 ppg Torq On Btm:

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA (LAST 6)

Supervisor 1: WADE FRAME MD Inci Azi TVD NI-S El-W VS DLS Bund
Supervisor 2: RODNEY MANIACI 10,184.0 0.20 106.73 10,183.44 25.6 -2.4 26.6 0.36 -0.35

Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 10,135.0 0.37 91.28 10,134.44 25.6 -2.7 25.6 0.40 -0.37

Geologist: KIRKSPARKMAN 10,040.0 0.72 81.10 10,039.44 25.6 -3.6 25.8 0.35 -0.34

Oxy Personnel: 0 9,944.0 1.05 16.81 9,943.46 26.3 -5.0 25.8 0.82 0.79
Contractor Personnel: 24 , . . . , .4 .

-
. . .

-

Total on Site: 24

BIT RECORD
BIt No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MDIn MDOut I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
RR 8 12.250 SECURITYDBS FMHX653ZX 11255966 M323 6x14 10,222.0 10,243.0 3-1-CT-N DB

B1TOPERATING PARAMETERS TODAY
BIt No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

MUD DATA - NE VPARK-AVA LAST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: SCOTT JONES / JASON MI MBT: 17.5 lbm/bbl BHANo: 10 BItNo: RR 8 MDIn: 10,222.0 ft
Sample From: PIT pH: 10.5 Pu ose: DRILLVERTICALHOLE MDOut: 10 243.0 ft
Mud Type: BRINE / POLYMERWBM Pm I Pom:
Time I MD: 0:01 / 10,242.0 Pf I Mf: 0.3 / 1.5 Com onent OD ID Jts Len th
Density @Temp: 10.50 / Chlorides: 176,000 =DCBIT 12.250 3.000 1 1.30
Rheology Temp: 120 Ca+ I K+: / AR T BL OT R
Viscosity: 44.00 CaCl2: -L
PVIYP: 14/10 Clom: -M GINT L I z 1 . 5 2.
Gels 10s/10m/30m:3 / 5 / 9 Lime: D 8. 0 2. 1 2 .4

API WL: 11.00 ES:
HTHP WL: ECD: 10.50
CakeAPIIHTHP: 2.0/ n/K: /
Solids I Sol Corr: 4.80 / 4.80 Carbonate: 3 I L LLAR .8 5 .0 5 1 2.9
Oli I Water: 0.0 / 85.0 Bicarbonate: I L

Sand: 0.05 Form Loss: 19.0 / 2,599.0 J ILL L R
Water Added: Fluid Disch: / ., SV . 2 .0 0
OIIAdded: -I P . . . 4
LGS: 4.80 / 43.50 RL
VG Meter: 2@3 / 3@6 / 11@100/ 18(C 200 / 24@300 / 38@600
Comments: CIRcULATil G & CONDITIONINGMUDWHILELOGGING Total Length: 1,243.92 ft Wt below Jars: 53,229.0 kip
HOLE.

MUD PRCDUCTS

ENG 24 HR
#1Product Units Oty used1.00 RECEIVED

ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00
NEW GEL 100 LBS/SK 40.00 DEC192008
NEWEDGE 50 LB/SX 20.00
SODA ASH 50 LBS/SK 15.00
TAX EACH 1.00 DIV.OFOlL,GAS&MINING

12/15/2008 9:27:44AM Page 1 of



OXYUSA
DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT

Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: 12/13/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 79

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 1:00 1.00 21|NDR LOG RIGUP P RIG UP TO RUN HDTDIP METER
1:00 1:30 0.50 21|NDR LOG RIGUP P CONDUCTPRE JOB SAFETY MEETINGWITHRIG PERSONAL, E-LINEPERSONAL,

&DSM
1:30 5:00 3.50 21INDR LOG OHLOG PT RUN DIP METERON ATLASE-LINETO 10,163' WLM.

NO PROBLEMSGETTINGDIP METERPAST 3900' INTERVAL.

OBTAINSEISMIC DATASHOTS EVERY250 FT.
TOOL FAILEDAT 10,163'WLM. PULLOUT ANDCHANGETOOL.

5:00 12:30 7.50 21INDR LOG OHLOG P RERUN DIP METERON ATLASE-LINE.WORKEDDIP METERTHRU 3900'
INTERVAI.
LOGGINGUP FROM 10,066'. THUMPINGEVERY250'.

12:30 13:30 1.00 21INDR LOG RIGUP P BREAKOUT DIP METERTOOL'S AND MAKE UP DIGITALSPECTRALOG (GAMMA)
DIGITALORIENTATION(ORIENTATION)6 ARMDIPLOG.TOTALLENGHT 57.49',
TOTALWEIGHT879#

13:30 19:00 5.50 21INDR LOG OHLOG P RUN INTHE HOLEWITHBAKERATLASTOOLS TO 10,155'.
19:00 21:00 2.00 21INDR LOG RIGUP P LAYDOWNTOOLS &RIG DOWNATLAS.
21:00 23:30 2.50 21INDR LOG RIGUP P RIG UP HALIBURTON&SIDE WALL CORE TOOL
23:30 0:00 0.50 21INDR LOG OHLOG P RUN SIDE WALLCORE TOOL TO 3885'. TAG BRIDGE

Total flme 24.0C
Safety Inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 66.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 66.00 LIGHTSNOW; 13 DEGREES AMBIENTTEMP; WIND15 MPH NWN;-3 DEGREES
Incident Comments: WINDCHILLFACTOR
No Incidents reported last 24 hours. 4 Safe work permits
Issued.
Other Remarks: DIESEL USED: 1,484 GAL. DIESEL ON HAND: 15688 GAL.RECD 4000 GALLONS.

NO ACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS.

HOLE TOOK 19 BBLS MUD IN LAST 24 HOURS.
TOTALLOSSES FOR SECTION 2166 BBLS

THIRDPARTYPERSONAL SIGNED IN = 13

12/15/2008 9:27:44AM Page 2 of



CONFIDENTIALDAILY OPERATIO RTNER REPORT
PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 12/14/2008

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILL VERT USA Report No: 80

Welibore: 00 Rig: NABORS797 Ref Datum: ORIGINALKB @7,920.00ft DFS: 44.19
Today's MD: 10,243.0 ft Progress: 0.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Dally Cost:
Prev MD: 10,243.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 0.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Ava ROP Today: 0.0 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: ARAPIENSHALE@4,720.0 Lithology:
Current Ops: TRIP OUT OF THE HOLEWITH12 1/4" BIT
24-Hr Summary: WIRELINELOG/ CLEANOUT RUNTO BOTTOM
24-Hr Forecast: LOG SIDEWALLCORES RUN CASING

CASINGlWELL CONTROL HOOKLOAD & TOROUE HYDRAULICS MUD GAS Avq Max
Last Casing: 13.375In @2,809ft Str Wt UplDn: 330.0/ 330.0 klp Pump Rate: 711.6 Conn:
Next Casing: 9.6251n@9,000ft Sir húiItoi: 321.0kip Pump Press: 2,850.0 Trip:
Last BOP Press Test: 12/06/2008 Torq Off Btm: 2.0 ft-Ibi Backgr:
Form Test/EMW: FIT/ 13.03 ppg Torq On Btm: 0.0 ft-Ibt

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA(t.AST 6)

Supervisor 1: WADE FRAME MD incI Azi TVD NILS El-W VS DLS Butid
Supervisor2: RODNEY MANIACI 10,184.0 0.20 106.73 10,183.44 25.6 -2.4 25.6 0.36 -0.35

10,136.0 0.37 91.28 10,134.44 25.6 -2.7 25.8 0.40 -0.37

Oxy Personnel: 0 , . . , , . .

-

Contractor Personnel: 24 , . . . , .4 .

-
. . .

-

Total on Site: 24

BIT RECORD
BIt No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No lADC Nozzles MDIn MDOut I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
RR7 12.250 HUGHES CHRISTE GX44CDX 6053967 23 3x32 10,243.0 -- - -

MUS DATA - NE ¾PARK-AVA LAST OR CURRENT BMA
Engineer: SCOTT JONES / JASON MI MBT: 17.5 lbm/bbi BHANo: 11 Blt No: RR7 MDIn: 10,243.0 ft
Sample From: OUT pH: 10.9 Pu ose: MD Out:
Mud Type: BRINEI POLYMERWBM Pm I Pom:

rp

Time I MD: 0:01 / 10,243.0 Pf I Mf: 0.3 / 1.1 Com onent OD ID Jts Len th
Density @Temp: 10.50 / 120 Chlorides: 163,000 FRI-CONEBIT 12.250 3.000 1 1.30
Rheology Temp: 120 Ca+ I K+: / 3 T
VIscosity: CaCl2: a

PV I YP: 15 / 12 Clom: 3 R . . 6 .8

Gels 10s/10m/30m:3 / 9 / 11 Lime: 3R R .5 2. 0 1 2.
API WL: 11.60 ES:
HTHP WL: ECD: 10.50
Cake API / HTHP: 2.0 / nl K: /
Sollds / Sol Corr: 5.80 / 5.80 Carbonate:

-l D 5.0 0 3. 0 9 9.
Oil / Water: 0.0 / 85.0 BIcarbonate:
Sand: 0.05 Form Loss: 2.0 / 2,601.0
Water Added: Fluid Disch: /
Oil Added:
LGS: 5.80 / 52.60
VG Meter: 2@3| 3@6 / 15@100 / 21(C200 / 27@300 / 42W600
Comments: FINISHEDLOGGlÑG. II·l.TIGHT SPOT FROl\A3,647 - Total Length: 1,204.63 ft Wt below Jars: 42,209.0 kip
4,UUUI- I. Al- I BR NBACHING BU I IUM, i WU NIGH Vlti HULL CLEANING
SWEEPS WERE PUMPED. POOH AT TIMEOF REPORT.

MUD PR( DUCTS
Product Units Oty used RECElVED

AQUABLOC 50 LB/SX 8.00
ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00 ny g
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00 Mi- *

FLOW-ZAN 25 LBSX 1.00
CWAP ER SMX

1
00 DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MlNING

SALTGEL 50 LBISX 50.00
SODA ASH 50 LBS/SK 15.00
TAX EACH 1.00
WALNUTPLUG M 50 LB/SX 10.00

12/15/2008 9:28:55AM Page 1 of



OXYUSA
DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT

Event: EXPLÐRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Oate: 12/14/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 80

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Detalls

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 2:00 2.00 21INDR LOG OHLOG P UNABLETO WORKTHROUGH BRIDGEAT 3885' WLM.CYCLETOOL SEVERAL

TIMES INANATTEMPTTO GET TOOLTO DROP IN. PULLOUT OF HOLE.
2:00 3:00 1.00 21\NDR LOG RIGUP P RIG DOWN HALIBURTONE-LINE

HOLETOOK 3.2 BBLS MUDSINCE MIDNIGHT
3:00 5:00 2.00 21INDR TRIP COND P PICK UP 12 1/4" INSERT BIT&6 1/4" DRILLCOLLARS.
5:00 7:00 2.00 21INDR TRIP COND P RUN INTHE HOLEFROM 1200' TO 3558'.
7:00 7:15 0.25 21lNDR TRIP COND P FILLPIPE ANDBLOWDOWNTOP DRIVE.
7:15 7:45 0.50 21\NDR TRIP COND P RUN INTHE HOLEFROM 3558' TO 3760'. TAKING20K DOWNWEIGHTAT 3740'. UP

WT 200K, DOWNWT 200K.
7:45 12:00 4.25 21INDR REAM RMTGT PT PULLOUT OF THE HOLETO 3,740'. INSTALLROTATINGRUBBER.

WASHANDREAMFROM 3,760' TO 3,769'. 60 RPM, OTO 2 KTQ, 400 GPM 563 PSI,
5 TO 15 WOB. RUN INTHE HOLEFROM 3,769' TO 3,790' WITHOUT PUMPS OR
ROTATION.TAKINGWT AT 3,769'. FROM 3,769' TO 3,790' SET 15K DOWNROTATE
STRING 2 ROUNDSWITHOUTANYSURFACE TORQUE. WEIGHTFELLOFF. WASH
ANDREAMFROM3,790' TO 3,956', AT 400 GPM 563 PSI, 60 RPM, 5 TO 15KWOB.
BACKREAMFROM3,956' TO 3,863'. REAMBACKDOWNTO 3,933' TAKING20K.
INCREASEGPM TO 700 AT 1410 PSI. RPMS FROM 100 TO 60, OTO 2K SURFACE
TORQUE. WASHINGTO 4,045'.

12:00 12:45 0.75 211NDR CIRC CNDHOL PT PUMP HI-VISSWEEP WHILEROTATINGAND RECIPROCATINGSTRING.
12:45 13:15 0.50 211NDR TRIP COND PT PULLOUT OF THE HOLEFROM4,045' TO 3,720'. NO PROBLEMS.
13:15 14:30 1.25 21lNDR TRIP COND PT RUN INTHE HOLEFROM 3,720' TO 4,210'. TAKING25K DOWNWT.
14:30 15:00 0.50 21|NDR REAM RMTGT PT WASHANDREAMFROM 4,210' TO 4,217' AT 700 GPM 1485 PSI, 50 TO 100 RPM,

TQ 0 TO 2K, 20 TO 30K WOB.
15:00 18:00 3.00 21INDR TRIP COND PT RUN INTHE FROM4,217' TO 9,968'. AT 5,770', 7,596' AND8,042'. THESE AREA

REQUIREDREAMINGFOR SHORT PERIODS.
18:00 18:30 0.50 211NDR TRIP COND PT RUN INHOLEFROM9,968' &TAG UP @10,138'.
18:30 19:00 0.50 21INDR REAM RMTGT PT WASH&REAMFILLFROM 10,138' TO 10243'

WOB= 10; RPM=75; TQ= 2K; 710 GPM= 2850 PSI
UP WT= 335K; DNWT= 330K; RT WT =327K
CORRECTED DEPTHTO 10,143'.

19:00 22:00 3.00 21\NDR CIRC CNDHOL P PUMP 20 BBLHIGHVIS SWEEP, DISPLACETO BIT, &PUMP ANOTHERHIGHVIS
SWEEP. CIRCULATESWEEPS OUT OF THE HOLE. SPOT 100 BBLHIGHVIS PILL
ON BOTTOM. MW=10.4 PPG

22:00 0:00 2.00 21\NDR TRIP DRILL P TRIP OUT OF THE HOLETO 5800'.
Total flme 24.00

Safety Inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 67.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 67.00 CLEAR; -17 DEGREES AMBIENTTEMP; WIND 6 MPH SW; -32 DEGREES WIND
Incident Comments: UHILLFACTOR
No Incidents reported last 24 hours.
Other Remarks: DIESEL USED: 2332 GAL.DIESEL ON HAND: 13356 GAL.RECD 0 GALLONS.

NO ACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS.

HOLETOOK 2 BBLS MUDINLAST24 HOURS.
TOTALLOSSES FOR SECTION 2168 BBLS

THIRDPARTYPERSONAL SIGNED IN = 13

12/15/2008 9:28:55AM Page 2 of



CONFIDENTIALDAliLY
OPERATIOoN

RTNER REPORT
PLATEAU,VALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: 12/15/2008

Prims Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Repoit No: 81

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS797 Ref Datum: ORIGINALKB@7,920.00ft DFS: 45.19
Today's MD: 10,243.0 ft Progress: 0.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 10,243.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 0.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Ava ROP Today: 0.0 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: ARAPIENSHALE@4,720.0 Lithology:
Current Ops: RUN 9 5/8" CASING
24-Hr Summary: CONT. TRIP OUT OF THE HOLE/ RUN ROTARYSIDE WALLCORE TOOLI CHANGE&TEST CASINGRAM/ RIUP &RUNCSG
24-Hr Forecast: RUN CASING&CEMENT
[ CASINGlWELLCONTROL HOOKLOAD & TOROUE HYDRAULICS MUD GAS Avg Max
Last Casing: 13.375ln @2,809ft Str Wt UplDn: / Pump Rate: 0.0 Conn:
Next Casing: 9.625In @9,000ft Str Ñt Rot: Pump Press: 0.0 Trip:
Last BOP Press Test: 12/06/2008 Torq Off Btm: Backgr:
Form Test/EMW: FIT/ 13.03 ppg Torq On Btm:

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA (LAST 6)

Supervisor 1: WADE FRAME MD Inst Azi TVD N/-S El-W VS DLS Build
10,184.0 0.20 106.73 10,183.44 25.6 -2.4 25.6 0.36 -0.35

,1 .0 .3 . 1 ,1 . 2 .6
-

.7 2 . .
-

Geologist: KIRKSPARKMAN , 4 . . . , . .
-

. . .

-

Oxy Personnel: 0 0,944.0 1.05 B.81 9,943.45 26.3 -6.0 25.8 0.82 0.79
Contractor Personnel: 24 , . . . , . .

-

. . .
-

Total on Site: 24 .
, , ,

.

BIT RECORD
BIt No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MDIn MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
RR7 12.250 HUGHES CHRISTE GX44CDX 6053967 323 3x32 10,243.0 1-1-WT-A 1-1-NO-LOG

BIT OPERATING PARAMETERSTODAY
BIt No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

MUD DATA - NENPARK-AVA LAST OR CURRENT BNA
Engineer: SCOTT JONES / JASON MI MBT: 17.5 lbm/bbi BHANo: 11 BItNo: RR7 MDIn: 10,243.0 ft
Sample From: PIT pH: 10.8 Pu ose: MDOut:
Mud Type: BRINE/ POLYMERWBM Pm / Pom:
Time I MD: 0:01 / 10,243.0 Pf / Mf: 0.3 / 1.1 Com onent OD ID Jts Len th
Density @Temp: 10.50 / 90 Chlorides: 171,000 TRI-CONEBIT 12.250 3.000 1 1.30
Rheology Temp: 120 Ca+ / K+: / 3 8. 0 .0

Viscosity: 47.00 CaCl2: -

PV I YP: 13 / 12 Clom: 3R C . .375 12 6 .

Gels 10s/10m/30m:3 / 7 / 10 Lime: . 0 2. 00 1 2.
API WL: 11.60 ES:

.0 .

HTHP WL: ECD: 10.50 I L 0
CakeAPIIHTHP: 2.0/ n/K: /
Soilds I Sol Corr: 5.20 / 5.20 Carbonate: iWDP . 0 . 0 19 79. 5
OIII Water: 0.0 / 85.0 Bicarbonate:
Sand: 0.05 Form Loss: 0.0 / 2,601.0
Water Added: Fluid Disch: /
011Added:
LGS: 5.20 / 47.10
VG Meter: 2 3 / 8@6 / 12@100 / 18( 200 / 25@300 / 38@600 "¯

Comments: POOl-IWITHNO TIGH HOLE SPOTS OR HOLE Total Length: 1,204.63 ft Wt below Jars: 42,209.0 kip
PROBLEMS ENCOUNTERED.FINISHEDALLLOGGINGOPERATIONS.
PREPARING TO RUN CASINGAT TIMEOF REPORT.

LOSSES ON REPORT DUE TO HOLEDISPLACEMENT.
MUD PRC DUCTS

Product Units Oty used RECEIVEDENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00
FIBER-SEAL 40 LBS/SK 6.00 DEC19 2008
FLOW-ZAN 25 LBSX 2.00
NEWEDGE 50 LB/SX 20.00
SALTGEL 50 LB/SX 80.00 DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING
SODA ASH 50 LBS/SK 13.00
TAX EACH 1.00

12/16/2008 8:14:05AM Page 1 of



OXYUSA
DAILYOPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT

Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: 12/15/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 81

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 0:30 0.50 211NDR TRIP WIPER P TRIP OUT OF HOLETO 4000'
0:30 1:00 0.50 21INDR CIRC CNDHOL P SPOT 100 BBLHIGHVIS PILLAT4000'
1:00 2:30 1.50 21INDR TRIP WIPER P TRIP OUT OF HOLE
2:30 3:30 1.00 21INDR LOG RIGUP P RIG UP HALIBURTONE-LINE&ROTARYSIDEWALLCORE TOOL
3:30 6:00 2.50 21\NDR LOG OHLOG P RUN ROTARYSIDEWALLCORE TOOLTO 6600'
6:00 10:30 4.50 211NDR LOG OHLOG P ROTARYSIDEWALLCORING INTERVALS.

1- 6,600' 2- 6,592'
3- 6,401' 4- 6,400'
5- 6,310' 6- 6,219'
7- 6,128' 8- 6,070'
9- 6,011 10- 6,002'
11- 5,992' 12- 5,934'
13-5,929' 14- 5,878'
15- 5,848' 16- 5,835'
17- 5,812' 18- 5,805'
19- 5,777'

10:30 11:15 0.75 21\NDR LOG RIGUP P RIG DOWN HES WIRE LINE.
11:15 12:00 0.75 21INDR BOP CHRAMS P REMOVEWEAR BUSHINGAND INSTALLTEST PLUG.
12:00 15:30 3.50 21INDR BOP CHRAMS P REMOVE5" RAM'SFROM UPPER PIPE RAM'SAND INSTALL9-5/8" RAM'S.
15:30 16:00 0.50 211NDR SAFE PJSM P PRE JOB SAFETYMEETINGWITHIPS PERSONAL.
16:00 17:00 1.00 21INDR BOP TSTBOP P TEST UPPER PIPE RAMDOOR SEALS TO 2000 PSI.
17:00 18:00 1.00 21INDR CSG RIGUP P RIG DOWNTESTERS, PULLTEST PLUG.
18:00 19:30 1.50 21INDR CSG RIGUP P RIG UP TO RUNCASING.
19:30 20:00 0.50 21|NDR CSG RIGUP P PREJOB SAFETYMEETING
20:00 0:00 4.00 21INDR CSG RIGUP P CONTINUETO RIG UP TO RUN CASING
Total (Ime 24.00

Safety Inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 68.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 68.00 LIGHTSNOW; 22 DEGREES AMBIENTTEMP; WIND14 MPH WSW; 9 DEGREES
Incident Comments: WIND CHILLFACTOR
No Incidents reported last 24 hours.
Other Remarks: DIESEL USED: 2,120 GAL.DIESEL ON IAND: 16,960 GAL.RECD 5405 GALLONS.

NO ACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS.

HOLETOOK 0 BBLS MUDINLAST24 HOURS.
TOTALLOSSES FOR SECTION 2168 BBLS

THIRDPARTYPERSONAL SIGNED IN = 13

12/16/2008 8:14:05AM Page 2 of



OXYUSA

CONFIDENTIALDAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: 12/16/2008

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILL VERT USA Report No: 82

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS797 Ref Datum: ORIGINALKB@7,920.00ftDFS: 46.19
Today's MD: 10,243.0 ft Progress: 0.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 10,243.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 0.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Avn ROP Today: 0.0 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: MOENKOPl@7,810.0 Lithology:
Current Ops: RUN 9 5/8" CASING
24-Hr Summary: RUN 9 5/8" CASING
24-Hr Forecast: RUN 9 5/8" CASING/ CEi 1ENTCASING

CASINGlWELL CONTROL HOOKLOAD & TOROUE HYDRAULICS MUD GAS Avg Max
Last Casing: 13.375In @2,809ft Str Wt UplDn: / Pump Rate: 0.0 Conn:
Next Casing: 9.625In @9,000ft StrWtRot: Pump Press: 0.0 Trip:
Last BOP Press Test: 12/06/2008 Torq Off Btm: Backgr:
Form Test/EMW: FIT/ 13.03 ppg Torq On Btm:

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA (LAST 6)

Supervisor 1: WADE FRAME MD IncI Azi TVD N/=S El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2: RODNEYMANIACI 10,184.0 0.20 106.73 10,183.44 25.6 -2.4 25.6 0.36 -0.35

10,135.0 0.37 97.28 10,134.44 25.6 -2.7 25.6 0.40 -0.37

Geologist: KIRKSPARKMAN , . . . . . .
-

. . .

-

Oxy Personnel: 0 9,944.0 1.05 18.81 9,943.46 26.3 -5.0 25.8 0.82 0.79
Contractor Personnel: 24 , . . . , . .

-
. . .

-

Total on Site: 24

B1T RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MDIn MDOut I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
RR7 12.250 HUGHES CHRISTE GX44CDX 6053967 323 3x32 10,243.0 10,243.0 1-1-WT-A 1-I-NO-LOG

BIT OPERATING PARAMETERSTODAY
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop BIt Noz Vel HHPS1

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

MUDDATA - NE MPARK-AVA LAST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: SCOTT JONES / JASON MI MBT: 17.5 lbm/bbl BHANo: 11 Bit No: RR7 MD In: 10,243.0 ft
Sample From: PIT pH: 10.8 Pu ose: MDOut: 10 243.0 ft
Mud Type: BRINE/ POLYMERWBM Pm I Pom:
Time I MD: 0:01 / 10,243.0 Pf I Mf: 0.3 / 1.1 Com onent OD ID Jts Len th
Density @Temp: 10.55 / 75 Chlorides: 172,000 FRI-CONEBIT 12.250 3.000 1 1.30
Rheology Temp: 120 Ca+ / K+: / 3 T . .0

Viscosity: 48.00 CaCl2: . 0 . 1
PV I YP: 12 / 9 Clom: 3R L .5 .

Gels 10s/10m/30m:3 / 5 / 8 Lime: ,R O . 0 2.
API WL: 11.80 ES:
HTHP WL: ECD: 10.50 2
Cake API I HTHP: 2.0 / n I K: /
Solids I Sol Corr: 5.60 / 5.60 Carbonate: WDP 5.000 . 0 9
Oli I Water: 0.0 / 85.0 Bicarbonate:
Sand: 0.05 Form Loss: 4.0 / 2,605.0
Water Added: Fluid Disch: /
Oli Added:
LGS: 5.60 / 50.70
VG Meter: 2@3 / 3 6 / 9@100 / 15 00 / 21@300 I 33@600
Comments: FINISHEDRIGGINGUP CASING TOOLS. RUWNIÑG Total Length: 1,204.63 ft Wt below Jars: 42,209.0 kip
CASING AT 4839FT ATTIMEOF REPORT.

**OTHERADDITIONSON REPORT DUE TO
DISPLACEMENT.**

MUD PR( DUCTS

ENG 24 HR
#1Product Units Oty used1.00 RECEIVED

ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00
NEWEDGE 50 LB/SX 24.00 DECi 92008TAX EACH 1.00

"I OF0thGAS&MINING

12/17/2008 9:28:09AM Page 1 of



OXYUSA
DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT

Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEY FEDERAL35-1 Date: 12/16/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 82

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 0:30 0.50 21|NDR CSG RUNCSG P PREJOB SAFETYMEETINGFOR RUNNINGCASING
0:30 3:00 2.50 21INDR CSG RUNCSG P RUN 9 5/8" CASINGTO 342'

PUMP THROUGHFLOATEQUIPMENT AT 167'
3:00 4:30 1.50 21lNDR SRFEQ REPR PT WHEN FILLINGJOINT, FRANKSTOOL PLUGGED. RIG DOWNFRANKSTOOL,AND

CLEARSALTCRYSTALPLUG INMUDSAVER VALVE.
4:30 5:00 0.50 21\NDR CSG RUNCSG P RUN CASINGTO 430'
5:00 5:30 0.50 21\NDR SRFEQ REPR PT WHEN FILLINGJOINT, FRANKSTOOL PLUGGEDAGAIN.REMOVETHE MUD

SAVERVALVEON THE FRANKSTOOL. PLUGGEDWITHSALTCRYSTALS.
5:30 6:15 0.75 21INDR CSG RUNCSG P RUN 9-5/8" 53.5# HCL-80 BTCCASINGTO 609'.

AVERAGEMAKEUP TORQUE 10,600 FOOT POUNDS.
6:15 9:00 2.75 211NDR OTHR OTHER PT TROUBLESHOOT POWER FAILURETO FRANKSSTABBINGBOARD.

PROBLEMFOUNDTO BE POWER CORD TO ELEC MOTORON STABBINGBOARD
GOT PULLEDFROM MOTOR.
CHANGEOUT ELEC MOTORAND POWER CABLE.

9:00 13:30 4.50 211NDR CSG RUNCSG P RUN 9-5/8" 53.5# HCL-80 BTCCASING FROM 609' TO 2,806'.
13:30 14:00 0.50 21\NDR CIRC CNDHOL P CIRCULATEBOTTOMSUP. 400 GPM, 117 PSI. 210K UP WT, 200K DWNWT.
14:00 15:00 1.00 21INDR CSG RUNCSG P RUN 9-5/8" 53.5# HCL-80BTC CASING FROM 2,806' TO 2,819'.
15:00 16:15 1.25 21\NDR OTHR OTHER PT REMOVEBJ 500 TON BASE PLATE, OPENING INBASE PLATESLOT TO SMALL(9"

16:15 17:30 1.25 21\NDR CSG RUNCSG P RUN 9-5/8" 53.5# HCL-80 BTC CASING FROM 2,819' TO 3,463'.
17:30 18:00 0.50 21\NDR CIRC CNDHOL P BREAKCIRCULATION.250K UP, 240K.
18:00 20:00 2.00 21|NDR CSG RUNCSG P RUN 9-5/8" 53.5# HCL-80 BTC CASING FROM 3,463' TO 4517'.
20:00 20:30 0.50 21INDR CSG RUNCSG P CHANGEOUT CASINGCOLLARON JT#111
20:30 0:00 3.50 21\NDR CSG RUNCSG P RUN9-5/8" 53.5# HCL-80BTC CASING FROM 4517' TO 6007'.

LAST24 HRS, ACTUALCASING DISPL. 155 BBLS:
CALCULATEDDISPLACEMENT159 BBLS.

Total flme 24.00
Safety Inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 69.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 69.00 PARTLYCLOUDY;11 DEGREES AMBIENTTEMP; WIND7 MPH SOUTH; 1
Bint Comments: UI-GRI-I-8 WIND CHILL FACTOR.
No incidents reported last 24 hours.
Other Remarks: DIESEL USED: 1,908 GAL.DIESELON IAND: 15,052 GAL.RECD 0 GALLONS.

NO ACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS.

HOLE TOOK 4 BBLS MUD INLAST24 HOURS.
TOTAL LOSSES FOR SECTION 2172 BBLS

THIRD PARTYPERSONAL SIGNED IN = 13

12/17/2008 9:28:09AM Page 2 of



OXYUSA

CONFIDENTIALDAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: 12/17/2006

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILL VERT USA Report No: 83

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS797 Ref Datum: ORIGINALKB@7,920.00ft DFS: 47.19
Today's MD: 10,243.0 ft Progress: 0.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 10,243.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 0.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 /98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Ava ROP Today: 0.0 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: MOENKOPI@7,810.0 Lithology:
Current Ops: CHANGE BOP BACKTO 5" RAM
24-Hr Summary: RUN &CEMENT9 5/8" CASING/ RUN &TEST PACKOFF / CHANGERAM&TEST BOPE.
24-Hr Forecast: TEST BOPE / PICK UP & (UN 8 1/2" BIT&DRILLINGASSY / DRILLOUT SHOE TRACK+ 20 FTI FIT
1 CASINGIWELL CONTROL NOOKLOAD &TOROUE HYDRAULICS UD GAS Avp Max
Last Casing: 13.3751n@2,809ft Str Wt UplDn: / Pump Rate: 0.0 onn:
Next Casing: 9.625\n @9,000ft Str Wt Rot: Pump Press: 0.0 p:
Last BOP Press Test: 12/06/2008 Torq Off Btm: Backgr:
Form Test/EMW: FIT/ 13.03 ppg Torq On Btm:

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA (LAST 6)

Supervisor 1: WADE FRAME MD inal Azi TVD Ni-S El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor2: RODNEY MANIACI 10,184.0 0.20 106.73 10,183.44 25.6 -2.4 25.6 0.36 -0.35

Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 10,135.0 0.37 97.28 10,134.44 25.6 -2.7 25.6 0.40 -0.37

Geologist: KIRKSPARKMAN 10,040.0 0.72 81.70 10,039.44 25.6 -3.6 25.8 0.35 -0.34

Oxy Personnel: 0 0,944.0 1.06 78.81 9,943.45 25.3 -5.0 25.8 0.82 0.79
Contractor Personnel: 24 , 8.0 .2 . , . .1

-

. . .3

-

Total on Site: 24
, . . 7 . 4 9, . .

-6. 2 . O. -

BIT RECORD
Blt No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MDIn MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code

BITOPERATINGPARAMETERSTODAY
BIt No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Blt Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

MUD DATA - NEVPARK-AVA LAST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: SCOTT JONES / JASON MI MBT: 15.0 lbm/bbi
Sample From: PIT pH: 10.8
Mud Type: BRINE/ POLYMERWBM Pm I Pom: Component i OD | ID I Jts | LengthTime I MD: 0:01 / 10,243.0 Pf I Mf: 0.2 / 1.0
Density @Temp: 10.50 / 100 Chlorides: 165,000
Rheology Temp: 120 Ca+ I K+: /
Viscosity: 49.00 CaCl2:
PV I YP: 10 / 8 Clom:
Gels 10s/10m/30m:3 / 6 / 9 Lime:
API WL: 11.80 ES:
HTHPWL: ECD: 10.50
CakeAPIIHTHP: 2.0/ n/K: /
Solids / Sol Corr: 5.60 / 5.60 Carbonate:
011I Water: 0.0 / 85.0 Bicarbonate:
Sand: 0.05 Form Loss: 0.0 / 2,605.0
Water Added: Fluid Disch: I
Oli Added:
LGS: 5.60 / 50.79
VG Meter: 2@3 / 3@6 / 8@100 / 13@: 00 / 18@300 / 28@600
Comments: FIbilSHED RUNNINGCASINGTO 10,225FT. DISPLACED
CEMENTWITH735BBLS OF FRESHWATERWITHNO RETURNSAT
SURFACE. DUMPINGANDCLEANINGPITS AT TIME

OF REPORT.
MUD PRf DUCTS

ENG 24 HR
#1Product Units Oty Used1.00 RECEIVED

ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00

DEC192008
DivOF0tL,GASS MINING

12/18/2008 8:57:52AM Page 1 of





CONFIDENTIALDAILY
OPERATK)NSU AARTNER

REPORT
PLATEAUVALLEY FEDERAL35-1 Date: 12/18/2008

Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILL VERT USA Report No: 84

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINALKB@7,920.00ft DFS: 48.19
Today's MD: 10,243.0 ft Progress: 0.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Dally Cost:
Prev MD: 10,243.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 0.00 hr AFE MD/Days: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Ava ROP Today: 0.0 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: MOENKOPI@7,810.0 Lithology:
Current Ops: TRIP INHOLEWITH8 1/2" RSS DRILLINGASSEMBLY
24-Hr Summary: TEST BOPE / PICK UP &RUN BHA#12 / TRIP INHOLE
24-Hr Forecast: TEST CASING/ DRILLS OE TRACK+ 20' NEW HOLE/ FIT-LOT/ DRILLAHEAD WITHRSS
| CASINGIWELL CONTROL HOOKLOAD & TOROUE ' HYDRAULICS UD GAS Avg Max
Last Casing: 13.375In @2,809ft Str Wt UplDn: / Pump Rate: 0.0 onn:
Next Casing: 9.625In @9,00011 StrWtÀot: Pump Press: 0.0 Trip:
Last BOP Press Test: 12/18/2008 Torq Off Btm: Backgr:
Form Test/EMW: FIT/ 13.03 ppg Torq On Btm:

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA (LAST 6)

Supervisor 1: WADEFRAME MD Inci Azi TVD N1-S El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2: RODNEYMANIACI 10,184.0 0.20 106.13 10,183.44 25.6 -2.4 26.6 0.36 -0.35

10,135.0 0.37 97.28 10,134.44 25.6 -2.7 25.6 0.40 -0.37

Oxy Personnel: 0 , . . . , . .
-

Contractor Personnel: 23 , . . . , . .
.

. . .

.

Total on Site: 23

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MDIn MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
11 8.500 AKEROILTOOLS 507HX 122686 M323 7x12 10,243.0 - - - -

BIT OPERATING PARAMETERSTODAY
BIt No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max mln/max

MUD DATA - NE NPARK-AVA LAST OR CURRENT BMA
Engineer: SCOTT JONES / JASON Mt MBT: BHANo: 12 Bit No: 11 MD In: 10,243.0 ft
Sample From: pH: 7.5 Pu ose: DRILL PRODUCTIONHOLE MDOut:
Mud Type: FRESH WATER POLYMEFPm I Pom:
Time I MD: 0:01 / 10,243.0 Pf I Mf: / Com onent OD ID Jts Len th
Density @Temp: 8.45 / Chlorides: 200 2DCBIT 8.500 1.750 1 1.20
Rheology Temp: Ca+ / K+: / . . . 8
Viscosity: 26.00 CaCl2: - 2 .

PV I YP: / Clom. - A S . .8

Gels 10s/10m/30m: I / Lime: D .0 0 2.8 1 24.2
API WL: ES:
HTHP WL: ECD:

- L
Cake API I HTHP: / n I K: /
Solids I Sol Corr: 0.90 / 0.90 Carbonate: 9 - I L i . 5 . 12 5.
011l Water: 0.0 / 99.1 BIcarbonate:
Sand: 0.00 Form Loss: 0.0 / 2,605.0 3 IL O R .5 .

Water Added: Fluid Disch: / , SS R . .8 2 . 4
Oli Added: P
LGS: 8.10 / 8.10 .,

,

VG Meter:
Comments: DUMPEDAMDCLEANED PITS. FILLEb PITS WITH Total Length: 1,291.68 ft Wt below Jars: 51,431.0 kip
I-Ktbi-I VVÄI I-M, ANÜ ÜÑEÜAÑINGTÛ SUILO MUÜ.GUMKI-N I LY I IN Al
TIMEOF REPORT.

MUD PR( DUCTS
Product Units Oty Used RECEIVED

ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENG24HR#2 1 1.00 DEC192008

DIVOFOIL,GAS&MiMNG

12/19/2008 6:56:46AM Page 1 of



OXYUSA
DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT

Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: 12/18/2008
Prim. Reason:ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 84

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Detalls

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 3:00 3.00 21|NDR BOP CHRAMS P CHANGEBOTTOMRANFROM 9 5/8" TO 5".
3:00 6:00 3.00 21INDR BOP TSTBOP P TEST BOPE 250 / 5000 PSI, ANNULAR250 / 2500 PSI FOR 10 MINUTESEACH.
6:00 9:00 3.00 21INDR BOP TSTBOP P TEST BOPE 250 /5000 PSI, ANNULAR250 /2500 PSI FOR 10 MINUTESEACH.
9:00 11:30 2.50 21\NDR SRFEQ RIGUP P INSTALLWEAR BUSHING.
9:00 9:00 0.00 21INDR BOP RDBOP P RIG DOWNIPS TEST EQUIPMENT.

11:30 14:45 3.25 211NDR TRIP BHA P PICK UP BHACONSISTINGOF 8.5" Q507HX, RSS, 8-3/8" OD STRING STAB, SAVER
SUB (FLOAT)MWD,FILTERSUB, NMDC,8-3/8" OD STRINGSTAB, X-O = 90.35'

14:45 16:30 1.75 21lNDR TRIP BHA P RUN INTHE HOLEWITH6-1/2" DRILLCOLLARS.PICKING3 MORE DC UP.
16:30 23:00 6.50 21\NDR TRIP BHA P RUN INTHE HOLEWITHHWDP. INSPECTING EACHJOINT OF HWDP.

LAIDDOWN8 JOINTS TOTAL.
(1 CRACKEDAND7 UNDERSIZED)

23:00 0:00 1.00 21INDR TRIP BHA P PICK UP 5 JTs HWDP&TRIP INHOLETO 10243'.
Total fime 24.00

Safety Inciden ? N Days since Last RI: 71.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 71.00 PARTLYCLOUDY;-11 DEGREES AMBIENTTEMP; WIND22 MPH SSW; -23

EcidentComments: UbuRbbs WINU UHILL FACTOR.
No Incidents reported last 24 hours.
Other Remarks: DIESEL USED: 1696 GAL. DIESEL ON HAND: 11448 GAL.RECD 0 GALLONS.

NO ACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS.

HOLETOOK 0 BBLS MUDINLAST24 HOURS.
TOTALLOSSES FOR SECTION 2172 BBLS

THIRDPARTYPERSONAL SIGNED IN = 4

12/19/2008 6:56:46AM Page 2 of
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CONFIDENTIALMX BMŸlONSáRŸÑëRÁÈÑORT
PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: Otí02/2000

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILLVERT ÙSA Repört Nor 9

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINALKB @7,920.00ft DFS: 63.19
Today's MD: 11,392.0 ft Progress: 65.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 11,327.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 24.00 hr AFE MD/Days: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Ava ROP Todav: 2.7 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:

Current Formation: KAIBAB@10,510.0 Lithology: MISSISSIPPIAN HORSESHOE MESA @11,230' DOLOMITEWl CHERT.

Current Ops: DRlLLAHEADW/ RSS & MOTOR FROM 11,32T.
24-Hr Summary: DRILLAHEADW/ RSS & MOTOR FROM 11,327' TO 11,392'.
9 pypegg CONT NUF TO PRI . AHFA Unt/ SS & OTO

CÁËINGiWELE C NTRÒL H00KLOAD & TOROUR HYDRAULICS MUDÈÀS Ava Mai

Last Casing: 9.675\n @10,260ft Str Wt UplDn: 373.0/ 360,0 kig Pump Rate: 494.0 Conn:

Next Casing: 5.500in @ 14,000ft Str Wt Rot: 371.0 kit Pump Press: 2,790.0 Trip:

Last BOP Press Test: Torg Off Btm: 3.0 ft-lb Backgr:
Form Test/EMW: LOT/ 14.05 ppg Torq On Btm: 4.0 ft-Ib

PERSONNEL 8ÛRiiEXDATA(LAST 6)

Supervisor 1: DUB CAMERON MD Inci Azi ÍVO N/-8 El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2: 11,288.0 0.00 12.36 11,287.15 41.7 -5.3 41.9 2.61 -2.61

Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 11,192,0 2.51 313.53 11,191.18 40.3 -3.8 40.2 1.26 -0.09

Geningist KIRKSPARKMAN 11,096.0 2.60 340.82 11,095.27 36.8 -1.5 36.4 0.83 0.48
Oxy Personnel: 0 11,000.0 2.14 356.82 10,999.35 32,9 -0.7 32.4 0.58 0.32
Contractor Personnel: 22 10,906.0 1.84 9.96 10,905.41 29.7 -0.9 29.3 0.06 0.00
Total on Site: 22 10.905.0 1.84 9.98 10 904.41 29.6 -0.9 291 1.62 1.62

BIYRECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MDIn MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code
16 8.500 SECURITYDBS FMH3645ZZ 11052936 M434 5x12, 1x13 11,221.0 11,450.0 1-2-NO-S 0-1-NO-TD

BIT D# RATINGPARAMETERSTODAŸ
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max
16 24,0 48.00 65.1 171. 2. 3. 12.0/15.0 23/30 0.68 395. 226.8 2.0

MUDDATA.NEMPARK.AVA LASYORCÚRRENTBHA
Engineer: JERRY TODDINICKLIGHTNEI MBT: 17.5 lbm/bbl BHANo: 17 Bit No: 16 MD In: 11,221.0 ft
Sample From: OUT pH: 10.3 Purpose: DRILLVERTICLE HOLE MD ut: 11,450.0 ft
Mud Type: LOW SOLIDS / NON-DISPER Pm / Pom: Comnonent OD ID Jts Lenath
Time I MD: 23:00 / 11,389.0 Pf I Mf: 0.3 / 0.7
Density @Temp: 8.70 / 120 Chlorides: 3,200 HWDP 5.00C 10 307.42

Rheology Temp: 95 Ca+ / K+: / DRILLINGJAR 6.376 1 32.38
Viscosity: 61.00 CaCl2: HWDP 5.00C 13 399.10
PV I YP: 21 / 15 Clom: CROSSOVER 6.500 1 3.04
Gels 10s/10m/30m: 9 / 24 /27 LIme: DRILLCOLLAR 6.50C 20 610.74
API WL: 7.10 ES: OROSSOVER 6.250 1 2.96
HTHP WL: 19.00 ECD: 8.80 NON-MAGDRILLCOLLAR 6.750 1 30.95
Cake API I HTHP: 2.0 / nl K: I 3-POINT NEAR BIT REAMER 6.75C 1 5.83
Solids / Sol Corr: 2.50 /2.50 Carbonate:
Oil I Water: / 97.5 Bicarbonate: STEERING TOOL 6.87E 1 29.77

Sand: 0.25 Form Loss: 12.0 / 2,737.0 CROSSOVER 6.50C 1 3.08

Water Added: Fluid Disch: / RSS (PUSH BIT) 6.25C 1 30.31
ORAdded: CROSSOVER 6.75C 1 3.94
LGS: 2.50 /22.68 ROTARYSTEERABLE MOTOR 6.75C 1 13.48
VG Meter: 5@3 / 6 6 / 19@100 / 27@2C3 / 36@300 / 57 600
Comments: DRILLEDAHEADTHROUGHOUT THE DAYTO 11389 Total Len¶th: 1,474.00 ft Wt below Jars: 76,672.0 kig
WITH NO PROBLEMS. PUMPED TWO 20 BBLLCM SWEEPS TO
CONTROL MINOR LOSSES.

MUI$ PR( DUdTS
Product Units QtyUsed

AQUABLOC 50LB/SX 12.00 RECEiVED
CAUSTIC SODA 50 LBISX 6.00
DYNAFIBER M 25 LBlŠX 20.00 JANO3 2009ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00
LFLMEW-ZAN 2

/
XX 00 DIVOFOll.,GAS&MNNG

NEW GEL HY 50 LBS/SK 10.00
NEWPAC LV 50 LB/SX 11.00
SODA ASH 50 LBS/SK 12.00
TAX EACH 1.00

1/5/2009 7:21;25AM Page 1 of



OXY USA

DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: 01/02/2009

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 99
I

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 6:00 6.00 31PRDR DRILL MTRVER P DRILLFROM 11,327' TO 11,353' OR 26' IN 6 HRS OR 4.3'lHR.WOB - 12-14K; RPM @

SURFACE - 25; RPM @ BIT 85; PUMP - 60 &60 @501 GPM @2,860 PSI. VIB'S,
SHOCKS, STICK - NON-EXISTANT.

6:00 10:00 4.00 31PRDR DRILL MTRVER P DRILLFROM 11,353' TO 11,358' OR 5' IN4 HRS OR 1.3'/HR. WOB - 12-14K; RPM
SURFACE - 30; VIB'S, SHOCKS, STICK - NON-EXISTANT.RPM @ BIT -85.

10:00 10:30 0.50 31PRDR RIGMT SRVRIG P RIG SERVICE.

10:30 0:00 13.50 31PRDR DRILL MTRVER P DRILLFROM 11,358' TO 11,392' OR 34' IN 13.5 HRS OR 2.5'lHR. WOB -12-14K; RPM
(SURFACE) - 30; RPM (BIT) - 82; VIB'S, SHOCKS, STICK - NON-EXISTANT.
SURFACE TORQUE -4.

Total Time 24.00

Safety Incident? N Days since Last RI: 86.00 Weather Comments:

Environ Incident7 N Days since Last LTA: 86.00 MOSTLYCLOUDY;LIGHTS/W WINDS, TEMP- 6 DEGREES.

Incident Comments:
No incidents reported last 24 hours.

Other Remarks: DIESEL USED -2,968 GALS; DIESEL ON HAND - 11,660 GALS; DIESEL REC. - 0.0.

1/5/2009 7:21:28AM Page 2 of



CONFIDENTIALDAILYOPERAÏI RTNER REPORT
PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERÀL35-f Date: 1/03/2009

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILLVERT Ù$A Report No: 100

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB @7,920.00ft DFS: 64.19
Today's MD: 11,450.0 ft Progress: 58.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 11,392.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 13.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Ava ROP Todav: 4.5 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:

Current Formation: KAIBAB@ii,230.0 Lithology: MISSISSIPPIAN HORSESHOE MESA - DOLOM1TE& CHERT.

Current Ops: DRlLLAHEADW/ RSS & MOTOR FROM 11,392'
24-Hr Summary: DRILLAHEADW/ RSS & MOTOR FROM 11,392' TO 11.450' - TD.
24-Hr Forecast: CONTINUE TO DRILLAHEA )TO TD © 11.500' OR BIT FAILURE.

CAëlNGIWELLCðNTROL HbOlu..OAD& TOROUE lìVDRAULICS MUD AS Ava ax

Last Casing: 9.675in @10,260ft Str Wt Up/Dn: 373.0/ 360.0 ki Pump Rate: 481À Conn:

Next Casing: 5.500in 14,000ft strWt Rot: 371.0 ki Pump Press: 2,735.0 Trip:

Last BOP Press Test: Torg Off Btm: 3.0 ft-Ib Backgr:
Form Test/EMW: LOT/ 14.05 ppg Torq On Btm: 4.0 ft-Ib

PEltSONNI:L BURVEYDATA(LAST 6)
Sunervisor 1: DUB CAMERON MD inci Azi TVD N/4 Ei-W VS DLS Bulki
Supervisor 2: 11,288.0 0.00 12.36 11,287.15 41.7 -5.3 41.9 2.61 -2.61

Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 11,192.0 2.51 313.53 11,191.18 40.3 -3.8 40.2 1.26 -0.09

Gen(nqlst KIRKSPARKMAN 11,096.0 2.60 340.82 11,095.27 36.8 -1.5 36.4 0.83 0.48
Oxy Personnel: 0 11,000.0 2.14 356.82 10,999.35 32.9 -0.7 32.4 0.58 0.32
Contractor Personnel: 22 10,906.0 1.84 9.96 10,905.41 29.7 -0.9 29.3 0.06 0.00
Total on Site: 22 10 905.0 1.84 9.98 10 904.41 29.6 -0.9 29.2 1.62 1.62

BIT RgcoëD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MDin MDOut t-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code

16 8.500 SECURITYDBS FMH3645ZZ 11052936 M434 5x12, 1x13 11,221.0 11,450.0 1-2-NO-S 0-1-NO-TD

lilT OPEAATING PARAMETERSTODAY
B1tNo Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max
16 13.00 61.00 58.( 229.0 4.6 3.1 12.0/15.0 23/30 0.682 395.1 226.8 2.0

NIUDDATA . NE NPARK-AVA LASYOR CÚláRENT-BHA

Engineer: JERRY TODDINICKLIGHTNEI MBT: 17.5 lbm/bbi BHANo: 17 Bit No: 16 MD In: 11,221.0 ft
Sample From: PIT pH: 10.2 Purpose: DRILLVERTICLE HOLE MD (-ut: 11 450.0 ft
Mud Type: LOW SOLIDS / NON-DISPER Pm I Pom: Comnnnent OD ID Jts I ennth
Time I MD: 23:00 / 11,450.0 Pf I Mf: 0.3 / 0.7
Density @Temp: 87.00 / 93 Chlorides: 3,000 HWDP 5.00C 10 307.42

Rheology Temp: 93 Ca+ l K+: / DRILLINGJAR 6.376 1 32.38
Viscosity: 61.00 CaCl2: HWDP 5.00C 13 399.10
PV I YP: 20 / 15 Clom: CROSSOVER 6.500 1 3.04
Gels 10s/10m/30m: 9 / 25 / 28 Lime: DRILLCOLLAR 6 50C 20 610.74
API WL: 7.10 ES: OROSSOVER 6.25C 1 2.96
HTHP WL: 19.00 ECD: 8.80 NON-MAGDRILLCOLLAR 6.75C 1 30.95
Cake API / HTHP: 2.0 / nl K: / 3-POINT NEAR BIT REAMER 6.75C 1 5.83
Solids I Sol Corr: / Carbonate:
Oil I Water: / 97.4 Bicarbonate: STEERING TOOL 6.87E 1 29.77

Sand: 0.25 Form Loss: 36.0 / 2,773.0 CROSSOVER 6.50C 1 3.08

Water Added: Fluid Disch: / RSS (PUSH BIT) 6.25C 1 30.31
011 Added: CROSSOVER 6.750 1 3.94
LGS: 2.60 / 23.58 ROTARYSTFFRABLE MOTOR 6.75C 1 13.48
VG Meter: 5 3 / 6@6 / 18 100 / 26 2C3 / 35 300 / 558600
Comments: TOOK LOSSES AT 11405 AND 11416 FT AND PUMPED Total Len¶th: 1,474.00 ft Wt below Jars: 76,672.0 kig
25 BBLS LCMSWEEPS ON BOTH OCCASIONS. DRILLEDAHEADTO
11450 WHERE TD WAS CALLED.PUMPED 75 BBLH\GH VIS SWEEP,

MUDPRt DUCTS CEIVED
Product Units qty Used

AQUABLOC 50 LB/SX 11.00 JANOS 2009CAUSTIC SODA 50 LBISX 5.00
DYNAFIBERM 25 LB/SX 10.00

NG HR
2 1 1 GAS&MNNG

FLOW-ZAN 25 LB SX 10.00
LIME 50 LBISX 4.00
NEWPAC LV 50 LB/SX 13.00
SODA ASH 50 LBSISK 21.00
TAX EACH 1.00

1/5/2009 7:21:42AM Page 1 of



OXY USA

DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 01/03/2009

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 100

OPERATIONS

From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details
Phase Code Sub Type

0:00 6:00 6.00 31PRDR DRILL MTRVER P DRILLFROM 11,392' TO 11,407' OR 15' IN 6 HRS OR 2.5'lHR. WOB - 14K; RPM
(SURFACE) - 30; RPM (BIT)- 82. VlB'S, SHOCKS, STICK, NON-EXISTANT.

6:00 19:00 13.00 31PRDR DRILL MTRVER P DRILL FROM 11,40T TO 11,450' OR 43' IN 13 HRS OR 3.2'lHR. TD WELL@ 11,450',
AS PER INSTRUCTIONS.

19:00 23:00 4.00 31PRDR CIRC CNDHOL P CIRCULATE& CONDITIONMUD. MIX100+ VIS SWEEP (50 BBLS), & PUMP AWAY.

SLB TOOL UNABLETO GET SURVEY @ TD, PRIOR TO SWEEP.

23:00 0:00 1.00 31PRDR TRIP DRILL P POOH FOR LOGS.

Total Time 24.00
Safety Incident7 N Days since Last RI: 87.00 Weather Comments:

Environ incident7 N Days since Last LTA: 87.00 S/E WINDS @20 MPH, SNOW FLURRIES, TEMP --6 DEGREES.

Incident Comments:
No incidents reported last 24 hours.

Other Remarks: DIESEL USED -2,756 GALS; DIESEL ON HAND - 13,356 GALS, DIESEL RECElVED -4,000 GALS.
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CONEIDENTIAL
PLATE U1/ALLEYFEDERAL3 Date 01/040009

Prim.Reason: ORIGDRILLVERT Ü$A Regär(No: 0

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINALKB @7,920.00ft DFS: 65.19

Today's MD: 11,450.0 ft Progress: 0.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:

Prev MD: 11,450.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Ava ROP Todav: 0.0 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: KAlBAB@11,230.0 Lithology: MISSISSIPPIAN HORSESHOE MESA @11,230'.

Current Ops: POOH FOR LOGS
24-Hr Summary: POOH FOR LOGS & LOG WELL

CÁËiNGIWELÚCÒNTROË ÑðOKL.OAD&TÓROU $YORAULICS MÚD GÀS A Ña
Last Casing: 9.675in @10,260ft Str Wt UplDn: / Pump Rate: 0.0 Conn:

Next Casing: 5.500Ín (al 14,000ft Str Wt Rot: Pump Press: 0.0 Trip:

Last BOP Press Test: Torg Off Btm: Backgr:

Form Test/EMW: LOT / 14.05 ppg Torg On Btm:

PERSONNEi. SURVEYDATA(LAST A)

Sunervisor 1: DUB CAMERON 101D inci Azi TVO NI-5 El•W VS DLS BuRd
Supervisor 2: 11,288.0 0.00 12.36 11,287.15 41.7 -5.3 41.9 2.61 -2.61

Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 11,192.0 2.51 313.53 11,191.18 40.3 -3.8 40.2 1.26 -0.09

Geningjg KIRKSPARKMAN 11,096.0 2.60 340.82 11,095.27 36.8 -1.5 36.4 0.83 0.48
Oxy Personnel: 0 11,000.0 2.14 356.82 10,999.35 32.9 -0.7 32.4 0.58 0.32
Contractor Personnel: 22 10,906.0 1.84 9.96 10,905.41 29.7 -0.9 29.3 0.06 0.00
Total on Site: 22 10 905.0 1.84 9.98 10 904.41 29.6 -0.9 29.2 1.62 1.62

Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out 1-O-D-L B-G-O-R
Code

16 8.500 SECURITYDBS FMH3645ZZ 11052936 M434 5x12, 1x13 11,221.0 11,450.0 1-2-NO-S 0-1-NO-TD

BIT OPERATING PARAMETERSTODAW
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop BIt Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

lilUDDATA . NE WPARK.AVA LAST OR CÚÀRENT BHA
Engineer: JERRY TODDINICKLIGHTNEl MBT: 17.5 lbm/bbl BHANo: 17 Bit No: 16 MD In; 11,221.0 ft
Sample From: PIT pH: 9.9 Purpose: DRILLVERTICLE HOLE MD ut: 11,450.0 ft
Mud TyMp W SO1LID5SŒ/0NON-DISPERPm IMPom:

0.3 / 0.6
Density @Temp: 8.70 / 81 Chlorides: 3,000 HWDP 5.00C 10 307.42

Rheology Temp: 81 Ca+ l K+: / DRILLINGJAR 6.376 1 32.38

Viscosity: 65.00 CaCl2: HWDP S.00C 13 399.10
PV I YP: 22 / 16 Clom: CROSSOVER 6.50C 1 3.04
Gels 10s/10m/30m: 11 / 26 / 31 Lime: DRILLCOLLAR 6.500 20 610.74
API WL: 7.00 ES: OROSSOVER 6.25C 1 2.96
HTHP WL: 19.00 ECD: 8.85 NON-MAGDRILLCOLLAR 6.75C 1 30.95
Cake API / HTHP: 2.0 / n I K: / 3-POINT NEAR BIT REAMER 6.75C 1 5.83
Solids I Sol corr: 2.60 / 2.60 Carbonate:
Oil I Water: / 97.4 Bicarbonate: STEERING TOOL 6.87E 1 29.77

Sand: 0.25 Form Loss: / 2,773.0 GROSSOVER 6.50C 1 3.08

Water Added: Fluid Disch: / RSS (PUSH BIT) 6.25C 1 30.31
011Added: CROSSOVER 6.750 1 3.94
4GS: 2.ß0 / 23.58 ROTARYATFFRARI F MOTOR 6.750 1 13.48
VG Meter: 6©3 / 7 6 I 21 100 / 298200 / 38 300 / 60 600
Comments: FINISHEDTOH WITH NO PROBLEMS. CURRENTLY Total Length: 1,474.00 ft Wt below Jars: 76,672.0 kig
LOGGING HOLE.

INTERVALLOSSES - 168 BBLS

MUOPRE DLídTa RECEiVED
Product Units Oty Used

AQUABLOC 50 LB/SX 2.00 JANOS2009
CAUSTIC SODA 50 LBlŠX 3.00
ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENG24HR#2 1 1.00 TVOFO!LGAS&MINING
FLOW-Z.AN 25 LB SX 2.00

LIME 50 LB/SX 1.00
NEW BAR 100 LB/SX 105.00
NEW GEL HY 50 LBS/SK 20.00

NEWPAC LV 50 LBISX 2.00

PALLETS EA. 12.00
SHRINK WRAP EA. 12.00

SODA ASH 50 LBS/SK 3.00
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OXY USA

DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 01/04/2009

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 101

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Tvpe
0:00 6:00 6.00 31PRDR TRIP DRILL P POOH FOR LOGS. WILETA - 06:00,

6:00 9:30 3.50 31PRDR TRIP DRILL P FINISH OUT OF HOLE. BREAK-OUT SLB TOOLS & L/D.

9:30 10:30 1.00 31PRDR LOG RIGUP P WILTECH ON PHONE W/ MR. SEALE, GEOLOGIST, AS TO LOGGING RUN AND
EXPEDITE LOGS.

10:30 13:00 2.50 31PRDR LOG RIGUP P R/U BAKER/ATLASFOR LOGS

13:00 19:30 6.50 31PRDR LOG OHLOG P TIH & LOG OPEN HOLE. SEND LOG DATATO MR. SEALE, FOR DECISION TO
DRILLAHEAD OR P &A. PREPARE TOOLS FOR 2ND RUN.

19:30 0:00 4.50 31PRDR LOG OHLOG P CONTINUETO LOG WELL.

Total Time 24.00
Safety Incident? N Days since Last RI: 88.00 Weather Comments:

Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 88.00 NIE WINDS @ 15; CLOUDY;TEMP --10 DEGREES.

Incident Comments:
No incidents reported last 24 hours.

Other Remarks: DIESEL USED - 3,180 GALS; DIESEL ON HAND - 10,176 GALS. SWEEP INQUESTION WAS PUMPED AFTER 3 FAILED
ATTEMPTS FOR SURVEY @ TD. SLB - D.D. COULD NOT WAKE-UPTOOL.
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CONFIDENTIAL LY O ÏIO ATNi!R EPORT
PLATEAU VÀLLEVrEDERAL 39-1 Dat 04/05/2009

Prim Reason: ORIODR1LLVERT Ù$A Regiort No: 10

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB @7,92000ft DFS: 66.19

Today's MD: 11,450.0 ft Progress: 0.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Dally Cost:

Prev MD: 11,450.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 0.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:

PBMD: Ava ROP Todav: 0.0 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: KAIBAB@11,230.0 Lithology: MISSISSIPPIAN HORSESHOE MESA @11,230'.

Current Ops: OPEN HOLE LOGGING
24-Hr Summary: OPEN HOLE LOGGING
74- nyecag CONTINUETO LOG GET D iCISION TO P & A OR DR1LLAHEAD

CASINGIWELLCÒNTROL HúOKLOAD & TORúUE AlYDRAULICS MUDâAS Ava qx
Last Casing: 9.675in @ 10,260ft Str Wt UplDn: / Pump Rate: 0.0 Conn:

Next Casinq: 5.500in @ 14,000ft Str Wt Rot: Pump Press: 0.0 Trip:

Last BOP Press Test: Torg Off Btm: Backgr:

Form Test/EMW: LOT / 14.05 ppg Torq On Btm:

PERSONNÈL BÚHVEYDATA(LA016)

Supervisor 1: DUB CAMERON MD inci Agl TVD NI-S EÏW S DL EfÑilcÏ
Supervisor 2: 11,288.0 0.00 12.36 11,287.15 41.7 -5.3 41.9 2.61 -2.61

Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 11,192.0 2.51 313.53 11,191.18 40.3 -3.8 40.2 1.26 -0.09

Geologist: KIRKSPARKMAN 11,096.0 2.60 340.82 11,095.27 36.8 -1.5 36.4 0.83 0.48
Oxy Personnel: 0 11,000.0 2.14 356.82 10,999.35 32.9 -0.7 32.4 0.58 0.32

Contractor Personnel: 22 10,906.0 1.84 9.96 10,905.41 29.7 -0.9 29.3 0.06 0.00
Total on Site: 22 10.905.0 1.84 9.98 10.904.41 29.6 -0.9 29.2 1.62 1.62

BIf RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MDIn MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code

BIT OPERATING PARAMETERSTODAÝ
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

NUD DATA-NE UPARK-AVA LAs10R CÚRRENTBHA
Engineer: JERRY TODDINICKLIGHTNEI MBT: 17.5 lbm/bbi
Sample From: PIT pH: 9.6
Mud Type: LOW SOLIDS / NON-DISPER Pm / Pom: I I I I

Time / MD: 22:01 / 11,450.0 Pf / Mf: 0.2 / 0.5
Comoonent | OD ID ¡ Jts Lenath

Density @Temp: 8.70 / 70 Chlorides: 3,000
Rheology Temp: 70 Ca+ / K+: /
Viscosity: 65.00 CaCl2:
PV I YP: 21 / 16 Clom:
Gels 10s/10m/30m: 10 / 26 / 31 Llme:
API WL: 7.00 ES:
HTHP WL: 19.00 ECD: 8.85
Cake API / HTHP: 2.0 / nl K: /
Solids I Sol Corr: 2.60 / 2.60 Carbonate:
Oil / Water: / 97.4 Bicarbonate:
Sand: 0.25 Form Loss: / 2,773.0
Water Added: Fluid Disch: /
OIIAdded:
LGS: 2.60 /23.58
VG Meter: 5@3 / 6@6 / 19@100 / 28@203 / 37@300 / 58 600
Comments: CONTINUING TO LOG HOLE.

INTERVAL LOSSES - 168 BBLS

MUDPRI DUCTS
Product Units Qty Used RECE IVED

ENG 24 HR#1 1 1.00
ENG24HR#2 1 1.00 JANO32009
TRUCKINGSERVICE EACH 1.00

DIVOFOLGAS&MINING
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OXY USA

DAILYOPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 01/05/2009

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 102

OPERATIONS

From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details
Phase Code Sub Type

0:00 6:00 6.00 31PRDR LOG OHLOG P CONTINUE TO LOG WELL: 3RD RUN.

6:00 10:00 4.00 31PRDR LOG OHLOG P TIH WITH LOGGING RUN #4 AND LOG WELL.

10:00 11:00 1.00 31PRDR LOG OHLOG P RECEIVED CALLFROM MR. SEALE. WANTS TO REPEAT MICRO LOG AND ADD
LATEROLOG. ADVISEBAKER/ATLASENGR. MUST GET TOOLS OUT OF VERNAL.

11:00 12:00 1.00 31PRDR LOG RIGUP P RIU CORE TOOL

12:00 20:00 8.00 31PRDR LOG OHLOG P TIH WITH CORE TOOL. SEE REMARKS FOR INTERVALS.

20:00 0:00 4.00 31PRDR WAIT WOEQ P W/O LOGGING TOOLS; DLL& MICRO LOG (REPEAT)

Total Time 24.00

Safety Incident? N Days since Last RI: 89.00 Weather Comments:

Environ incident? N Days since Last LTA: 89.00 CLOUDYWITH SIW WINDS; TEMP - -6 DEGREES.

Incident Comments:
No incidents reported last 24 hours.

Other Remarks: DIESEL USED - 1,484 GALS; DIESEL ON HAND -8,692 GALS. LOGS RUN: #1 - (HDIL,DAL,CZD,CNL,GR)RUN #2 - REPEAT
(REPEAT HDIL)RUN #3 - (MLL)RUN #4 - (HEX DIP) RUN # 5 - (RSWC) RUN # 6 - (REPEAT MLLDUE TO TOOL FAILURE)
CORES AS FOLLOWS:
11435,11426,11422,11405,11374,11368,11364,11355,11336,11315,11282,11255,11245,11140,11130,11125,11042,10898,10744,10
734 & 10463'. 21 OF 21 CORES RECOVERED. W/L TD ON ALLRUNS 11 469'.
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CONFIDENTIALDAILY OPERATK)NS ARTN R REPORT
PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 5-1 Date· 01/06/2009

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 103

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINALKB @7,920.00ft DFS: 67.19

Today's MD: 11,450.0 ft Progress: 0.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:

Prev MD: 11,450.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 0.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:

PBMD: Ava ROP Todav: 0.0 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: KAIBAB@11,230.0 Lithology: MISSISSIPPIAN HORSESHOE BEND @11,230'

Current Ops: WAITON LOGGING TOOLS
24-Hr Summary: OPEN HOLE LOGGING &WlO LOGGING TOOLS.
74- o peng SET CEMENT ABANDOMEF T PLUGS

CASINGIWELI CÒNTROL H00KLOAb &TORÒUK ÑYDRAULlÒS MUD$ÂS A Ñai
Last Casing: 9.675in @10,260ft Str Wt UplDn: / Pump Rate: 0.0 Conn:

Next Casing: 5.5001n @ 14,000ft Str Wt Rot: Pump Press: 0.0 Trip:

Last BOP Press Test: 12/18/2008 Torg Off Btm: Backgr:

Form TestlEMW: LOT / 14.05 ppg Torq On Btm:

PEÑSONNÈU BURVEYBATA(LA 16)
Supervisori: WADEFRAME MD tÑci A ÌVÚ NI4 EÑIt VS Su!Ïd
Supervisor 2: 11,288.0 0.00 12.36 11,287.15 41.7 -5.3 41.9 2.61 -2.61

Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 11,192.0 2.51 313.53 11,191.18 40.3 -3.8 40.2 1.26 -0.09

Geologist: KIRKSPARKMAN 11,096.0 2.60 340.82 11,095.27 36.8 -1.5 36.4 0.83 0.48

Oxy Personnel: 0 11,000.0 2.14 356.82 10,999.35 32.9 -0.7 32,4 0.58 0.32
Contractor Personnel: 22 10,906.0 1.84 9.96 10,905.41 29.7 -0.9 29.3 0.06 0.00
Total on Site: 22 10.905.0 1.84 9.98 10 904.41 29.6 -0.9 29.2 1.62 1.62

alT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serlal No IADC Nozzles MD in MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code

BIT OAENATING ARAMiiTERSTODAY
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop BIt Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs minlmax min/max

lulUD DATA-NE MPAAK.AVA LASY0A CURRENT BHA
Engineer: SCOTT JONES/NICK LIGHTNI MBT: 17.5 lbm/bbl
Sample From: PIT pH: 9.5
Mud Type: LOW SOLIDS / NON-DISPER Pm / Pom: Comoonent OD ID Jts Lenath
Time / MD: 22:00 / 11,450.0 Pf / Mf: 0.2 / 0.5
Density @Temp: 8.70 / 58 Chlorides: 3,000
Rheology Temp: 62 Ca+ l K+: /
Viscosity: 64.00 CaCl2:
PV I YP: 20 / 14 Clom:
Gels 10s/10m/30m: 10 / 25 / 29 Lime:
API WL: 7.10 ES:
HTHP WL: 19.00 ECD: 8.85
Cake API / HTHP: 2.0 / nl K: /
Solids I Sol Corr: 2.60 / 2.60 Carbonate:
Oil / Water: / 97.4 Bicarbonate:
Sand: 0.25 Form Loss: 0.0 / 2,773.0
Water Added: Fluid Disch: /
Oli Added:
LGS: 2.60 /23.58
VG Meter: 5@3 / 6©6 / 18@i00 / 26@20] I 34@300 I 54©,600
Comments: FINISHED LOGGING HOLE. WORKING AT BUILDING400
BBLS OF 10.7 LB/BBLMUDTO USE AS PLUG MUD. CURRENTLY

TRIPPING IN HOLE OPEN ENDED TO BEGIN CEMENT JOB.

Product Units Oty Used
ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00

DIVOFDILGAS&MINING
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OXY USA

DAILYOPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 01/06/2009

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 103

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 2:00 2.00 31PREV WAIT WOEQ PT WlO DLL& MICRO LOG TOOLS. TOOLS ARRIVED@ 02:00.

2:00 5:00 3.00 31PREV LOG OHLOG P MAKEUP TOOLS, TlH & LOGGING, (ML).

5:00 6:00 1.00 31PREV LOG RIGUP P L/D ML,M/U DLL&TIH FOR LOGS.

6:00 10:00 4.00 31PREV LOG OHLOG P LOG OPEN HOLE W/ DLL.L/DTOOLS.

10:00 10:30 0.50 31PREV LOG RIGUP P R/D BAKER/ATLAS

10:30 11:30 1.00 61ABND WAIT WOORD PT WAITON ORDERS FOR DISPOSITION OF WELL.

11:30 14:30 3.00 61ABND TRIP PULD P USING "MOUSE HOLE", BREAK-OUTDC'S & L/D SAME.

14:30 16:30 2.00 61ABND TRIP PULD P LAYDOWN HWDP.

16:30 22:30 6.00 61ABND TRIP PULD P PICK UP 36 JOINTS OF DRILLPIPE (1,126')

22:30 0:00 1.50 61ABND TRIP CMT P RUN INTHE HOLE TO 4930'.

Total Time 24.00
Safety Incident? N Days since Last RI: 90.00 Weather Comments:

Environ incident? N Days since Last LTA: 90.00 CLEAR -3 DEG. NW WIND @ 13 MPH, WIND CHILL-7.

Incident Comments:
No incidents reported last 24 hours.

Other Remarks: DIESEL USED -1,696 GALS; DIESEL ON HAND - 13,780 GALS; DIESEL RECEIVED -8,000 GALS.

LOGS: FINALRUN (DLL) WIL TD ON ALLLOGGING RUNS - 11,469'.

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS.

HOLE TOOK 0 BBLS MUD IN LAST24 HOURS.
TOTAL LOSSES FOR SECTION OBBLS

THIRD PARTY PERSONAL SIGNED IN = 11
DAYLIGHTCREW - FULL.
NIGHT CREW SHORT HANDED 1
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CONFIDENTIAL DAlLYOPERATIO S ARTNERREPORT
...4. . L. . ... ... PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: Oi/07/2009

Prbre.Àöääún lilÒ0 ILLVERT USA Report No: 104

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB@7,920.00ft DFS: 68.19

Today's MD: 11,450.0 ft Progress: 0.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:

Prev MD: 11,450.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 0.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 /98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Ava ROP Todav: 0.0 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: KAIBAB@11,230.0 Lithology:

Current Ops: POOH L/D EXCESS DP.
24-Hr Summary: SET CEMENT ABANDOMENTPLUGS AT 11,204', 10,351', 7,025'
74. n pcmg CHANGE OUT HYDRILELE AENT FREE POINT 9-5/8" CASING.

CÁSfÑGIWELÛËNTROL i Okt0ADiTÖRúUE HYDRAULICS MUDÊÀS Wie
Last Casing: 9.675in @ 10,260ft Str Wt Up/Dn: / Pump Rate. 0.0 Conn:

Next Casing: 5.500\n @ 14 000tt Str Wt Rot: Pump Press: 0.0 Trip:

Last BOP Press Test: 12/18/2008 Torg Off Btm: Backgr:

Form Test/EMW: LOT / 14.05 ppg Torq On Btm:

PENSOÑÑEL SURV !Y DATA(LAST 6)

Supervisor 1: WADE FRAME MD inct Ag TV6 NI-S El-W VS p B011d
Supervisor 2: 11,288.0 0.00 12.36 11,287.15 41.7 -5.3 41.9 2.61 -2.61

Enqineer: RUSTY HANNA 11,192.0 2.51 313.53 11,191.18 40.3 -3.8 40.2 1.26 -0.09

Geoloqist: KIRKSPARKMAN 11,096.0 2,60 340.82 11,095.27 36.8 -1.5 36.4 0.83 0.48

Oxy Personnel: 0 11,000.0 2.14 356.82 10,999.35 32.9 -0.7 32.4 0.58 0.32
Contractor Personnel: 22 10,906.0 1.84 9.96 10,905.41 29.7 -0.9 29.3 0.06 0.00
Total on Site: 22 10.905.0 1.84 9.98 10,904.41 29.6 -0.9 29.2 1.62 1.62

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No lADC Nozzles MDIn MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code

BIT OPEAATINé PÀRAMÊTERS f0DAY
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

D DATA«NE NPARK.ÁVA LÅSÝOÀCÚRREÑT BNA
Engineer: SCOTT JONES / JASON MOO MBT: 17.5 lbm/bbi
Sample From: PIT pH: 9.6
Mud Type: DISPERSED / FRESH WBM Pm / Pom: Comoonent OD ID Jts Lenath
Time / MD: 0:01 / 11,450.0 Pf I Mf: 0.2 / 0.5
Density @Temp: 9.00 / 56 Chlorides: 3,000
Rheology Temp: 120 Ca+ l K+: /
Viscosity: 66.00 CaCl2:
PV I YP: 20 / 15 Clom:
Gels 10s/10m/30m: 9 / 22 / 27 Lime:
API WL: 7.20 ES:
HTHP WL: 19.00 ECD:
CakeAPIIHTHP: 2.0/2.0 n/K: /
Solids I Sol Corr: 2.90 / 2.90 Carbonate:
Oil / Water: 0.0 / 97.0 Bicarbonate:
Sand: 0.25 Form Loss: 0.0 I 2,773.0
Water Added: Fluid Disch: /
OII Added:
LGS: 1.10 / 9.76
VG Meter: 4@3 / 6@6 / 17@100 / 24@200 / 35©300 / 55 600
Comments: PUMPED BALANCEDCEMENT PLUGS AT 11,200, 10226,
AND 7000FT. LAYDOWN DP AND PUMPED 350 BBL 10.7PPG PILLAT

5,000. POOH AND RACK BACK DP TO CUT AND RECOVER 9.625"

MülíPIN D CTS
Product Units QtyUsed RECEivED

ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00
NEW BAR 100 LB/SX 400.00
TAX EACH 1.00

DIVOFDILGAS&MMU
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OXY USA

DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 01/07/2009

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 104

OPERATIONS

From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details
Phase Code Sub Type

0:00 2:00 2.00 61ABND TRIP CMT P RUN INTHE HOLE FROM 4,930' TO 10,159'. 9-5/8" CASING SHOE @10,226'.

2:00 3:00 1.00 61ABND CMT PLUG PT WAITON HALLIBURTON.

NOTE: HALLIBURTONLEFT GRANDJUNCTION YARD @ 17:30 HOURS ON
01-06-2009

3:00 4:15 1.25 61ABND TRIP CMT P RUN INTHE HOLE FROM 10,159' TO 11,204'.

4:15 5:45 1.50 61ABND CIRC CNDFLD P CIRCULATE @650 GPM, 2180 PSI. WHILE HALLIBURTONRIGS UP.

5:45 6:00 0.25 61ABND SAFE PJSM P PRE JOB SAFETY MEETING.

6:00 7:00 1.00 61ABND CMT RIGUP P RIG UP HALLIBURTON.TEST LINES

7:00 7:30 0.50 61ABND CMT REM P PUMP 20 BBLS WATER 65 SACKS OF THERMACEMCEMENT 17.6 BBL 15.8 PPG,
7.7 BBLS OF WATER, DISPLACE WITH 183 BBLS OF 8.3 PPG MUD.CALCULATED
TOP OF PLUG 10,950'.
NO CONTAMINATEDMUDAT BOTTOMS UP,

7:30 8:00 0.50 61ABND TRIP CMT P PULLOUT OF THE HOLE TO 10,351'.

8:00 9:00 1.00 61ABND CIRC CNDFLD P CIRCULATE@540 GPM 1900 PSI

9:00 10:00 1.00 61ABND CMT REM P PUMP 20 BBLS WATER 80 SACKS OF THERMACEMCEMENT 1.523 FTISK 21.7 BBL
15.8 PPG, 7.6 BBLS OF WATER, DISPLACE WITH 183 BBLS OF 8.3 PPG MUD.
CALCULATEDTOP OF PLUG 10,053'.
NO CONTAMINATEDMUDAT BOTTOMS UP.

10:00 10:30 0.50 61ABND TRIP CMT P PULLOUT OF THE HOLE TO 9,400'

10:30 11:30 1.00 61ABND CIRC CNDHOL P CIRCULATE@ 540 GPM 1370 PSL

11:30 12:30 1.00 61ABND TRIP CMT P PULL OUT OF THE HOLE TO 7,025'.

12:30 13:15 0.75 61ABND CMT REM P PUMP 20 BBLS WATER, 90 SACKS OF THERMACEMCEMENT 1.148 FT/SK 18.5 BBL
15.8 PPG, 7.6 BBLS OF WATER, DISPLACE WITH 109 BBLS OF 8.3 PPG MUD.
CALCULATEDTOP OF PLUG 6,733'.
NO CONTAMINATEDMUDAT BOTTOMS UP.

13:15 14:00 0.75 61ABND TRIP CMT P PULLOUT OF THE HOLE TO 5,609'
RACKEDBACKIN THE DERRICK 5,500' OF DRILLPIPE.

14:00 16:00 2.00 61ABND CIRC CNDHOL P CIRCULATE @ 540 GPM, 863 PSI. RIG DOWN HALLIBURTON, RIG UP
WEATHERFORD TRS LAYDOWNTRUCK.

16:00 17:00 1.00 61ABND TRIP PULD P PULL OUT OF THE HOLE LAYlNGDOWN EXCESS DRILLPIPE TO 5,000'.

17:00 19:00 2.00 61ABND CIRC CHOVR P DISPLACE WELL BORE WITH 320 BBLS OF 10.7 PPG MUD.

19:00 0:00 5.00 61ABND TRIP PULD P PULLOUT OF THE HOLE LAYlNGDOWN EXCESS DRILLPIPE.

Total Iime 24.00
Safety Incident7 N Days since Last RI: 91.00 Weather Comments:

Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 91.00 OVERCAST, 28 DEG.

incident Comments:
No incidents reported last 24 hours. 5 Safe work permits issued.

Other Remarks: DIESEL USED - 1696 GALS; DIESEL ON HAND - 12084 GALS; DIESEL RECEIVED - 0 GALS.

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS.

HOLE TOOK 0 BBLS MUDIN LAST 24 HOURS.
TOTAL LOSSES FOR SECTION 0 BBLS

THIRD PARTY PERSONAL SIGNED IN = 15
DAYCREW - FULL.
NIGHT CREW SHORT HANDED i
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OXY USA

DAILY OPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 01/08/2009
Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 105

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 0:30 0.50 61ABND TRIP PULD P RIG DOWN WEATHERFORD TRS LAYDOWN TRUCK.

0:30 4:00 3.50 61ABND BOP CHRAMS PT ATTEMPT TO PULLWEAR BUSHING, WEAR BUSHING BECAMESTUCK INTHE
HYDRIL PULLINGLOOSE OF RUNNINGTOOL IN HYDRIL.CLOSE BLINDRAMS
APPLY 450 PSI CLOSING PRESSURE ON HYDRILELEMENT,DRESS DOGS ON
RUNNINGTOOL AND EN GAUGE WEAR BUSHING. REMOVE THE 450 PSI
CLOSING PRESSURE TO HYDRIL.PUSH WEAR BUSHINGTHRU HYDRILELEMENT
AND RUN IN LOCKDOWN SCREWS.
REMOVE RUNNINGTOOL.
WEAR BUSHING OD 13.18"

4:00 6:00 2.00 61ABND BOP CHRAMS PT PREPARE TO CHANGE OUT HYDRILELEMENT. REMOVE DRILLINGRISER AND
FLOW FLOW.

6:00 15:30 9.50 61ABND WAIT WOEQ PT WAITON HYDRIL ELEMENT.

15:30 18:00 2.50 61ABND RIGMT REP PT CHANGE OUT HYDRILELEMENT.

18:00 19:30 1.50 61ABND BOP CHRAMS PT NILLPLEUP DRILLINGRISER AND FLOW LINE.

19:30 20:30 1.00 61ABND BOP CHRAMS P PULL WEAR RING.

20:30 0:00 3.50 61ABND WAIT WOEQ P WAIT ON IPS (BOP TESTERS)

Total Time 24.00

Safety Incident? N Days since Last RI: 92.00 Weather Comments:
Environ incident? N Days since Last LTA: 92.00 CLEAR AND 21 DEG, 28 MPH NORTH WIND,WIND CHILL -10,

Incident Comments: 6" OF FRESH SNOW.

No incidents reported last 24 hours. 3 Safe work permits issued.

Other Remarks: DIESEL USED - 1,908 GALS; DIESEL ON HAND - 10,176 GALS; DIESEL RECEIVED -0 GALS.

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS.

HOLE TOOK 0 BBLS MUDIN LAST 24 HOURS.
TOTAL LOSSES FOR SECTION 0 BBLS

THIRD PARTY PERSONAL SIGNED IN = 10
DAYCREW - FULL.
NIGHT CREW FULL.

1/9/2009 6:56:31AM Page 2 of



7'Ä¾ R 0 / to S -.35 6/3 07/-300 6o
CONFIDENTIALDAILYOPERATIONS ARTNER REPORT

PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 01/09/2009
Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 106

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB @7,920.00ft DFS: 70.19
Today's MD: 3,000.0 ft Progress: 3,000.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:
Prev MD: 11,450.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 0.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 /98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Ava ROP Todav: 0.0 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: KAIBAB@11,230.0 Lithology:

Current Ops: RIGGING UP WEATHERFORD TRS LAY DOWN TRUCK.
24-Hr Summary: FREE POINT 9-5/8" CASING, CUT 9-5/8" CASING, CIRCULATE.
74-¶¶nrecasy LAY DOWN CASING. R/D C.-,SINGEQUIPMENT. RIH T/2900'

CASINGIWELLCONTROL HOOKLOAD&TOROUE HYDRAULICS MUDGAS Ava Max

Last Casing: 9.675in @ 10,260ft Str Wt UplDn: 140.0/ 140.0 kip Pump Rate: 255.4 Conn:

Next Casing: 5.500in @ 14,000ft Str Wt Rot: 140.0 kip Pump Press: 766.0 Trip:

Last BOP Press Test: 12/18/2008 Torg Off Btm: 0.0 ft-Ib Backgr:
Form Test/EMW: LOT / 14.05 ppg Torq On Btm: 0.0 ft-Ib.

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA(LAST 6)
Supervisor 1: WADE FRAME MD Incl Azi TVD N/•S El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2: 11,288.0 0.00 12.36 11,287.15 41.7 -5.3 41.9 2.61 -2.61

Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 11,192.0 2.51 313.53 11,191.18 40.3 -3.8 40.2 1.26 -0.09

GeçIegist: KIRKSPARKMAN 11,096.0 2.60 340.82 11,095.27 36.8 -1.5 36.4 0.83 0.48
Oxy Personnel: 0 11,000.0 2.14 356.82 10,999.35 32.9 -0.7 32.4 0.58 0.32
Contractor Personnel: 17 10,906.0 1.84 9.96 10,905.41 29.7 -0.9 29.3 0.06 0.00
Total on Site: 17 10.905.0 1.84 9.98 10.904.41 29.6 -0.9 29.2 1.62 1.62

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No lADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code

BITOPERATING PARAMETERSTODAY
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

MUD DATA - NE VPARK.AVA LAST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: SCOTT JONES / JASON MOO MBT: 17.51bm/bbl
Sample From: OUT pH: 9.6
Mud Type; DISPERSED / FRESH WBM Pm I Pom: Comoonent OD ID Jts Lenath
Time / MD: 0:01 / 3,000.0 Pf / Mf: 0.3 / 0.5
Density @Temp: 9.60 / 74 Chlorides: 2,800 DRILL PIPE
Rheology Temp: 120 Ca+ l K+: / CROSSOVER 6.250 2.375 1 2.17
Viscosity; 60.00 CaCl2: CROSSOVER 5.625 2.375 1 1.61
PV I YP: 22 / 13 Clom. cUTTER 5,625 2.750 1 3.96
Gels 10s/10m/30m: 7 / 17 / 23 Lime:
API WL: 14.00 ES:
HTHP WL: ECD:
Cake API I HTHP: 2.0 / n I K: /
Solids / Sol Corr: 5.00 / 4.90 Carbonate:
Oil / Water: 0.0 / 95.0 Bicarbonate:
Sand: 0.05 Form Loss: 0.0 / 2,773.0
Water Added: Fluid Disch: /
Oil Added:
LGS: 0.60 / 5.30
VG Meter: 3@3 / 8@6 / 14@100 / 22@200 / 35@300 / 57@600
Comments: TlH WITH CASING CUTTER TOOL. CUT CASING AND
ENCOUNTERED SATURATED SALT MUD. ClRCULATED BOTTOMS UP.
BUILT 2 POUND OVER PILL. POOH AND LAYEDDOWN DRILL PIPE.

Product Units Qty Used
ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENNEG24AHRR#2

100
L1B/SX

80
000 RECEIVED

TAX EACH 1.00

JAN2 O2009

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
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OXY USA

DAILYOPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 01/09/2009
Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 106

i

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 1:00 1.00 61ABND WAIT WOEQ PT WAITON IPS (BOP TESTERS)
1:00 1:30 0.50 61ABND SRFEQ RIGUP P INSTALL TEST PLUG AND RIG UP IPS.

1:30 2:00 0.50 61ABND SAFE PJSM P PRE JOB SAFETY MEETING.

2:00 2:30 0.50 61ABND BOP TSTBOP P TEST HRDRIL 250 LOW PSI, 3500 PSI HIGH.
2:30 3:00 0.50 61ABND SRFEQ RIGUP P RIG DOWN IPS.
3:00 4:45 1.75 61ABND TRIP DRILL P MAKEUP 7-1/4" SPEAR, DRESSED WITH 8.688" GRAPPLE.
4:45 5:00 0.25 61ABND SAFE PJSM P PRE JOB SAFETY MEETING.
5:00 7:30 2.50 61ABND LOG RIGUP P RIG UP DCT WIRE LINE,HANG SHEAVE IN DERRICK

0 PSI ON 13-3/8 X 9-5/8 ANNUALS.
7:30 8:00 0.50 61ABND FISH OTH P EN GAUGE 9-5/8" MANDREL HANGER AND PICK UP TO 530K. HANGER OFF SEAT

AT 430K

8:00 8:30 0.50 61ABND LOG WLWRK P RUN INTHE HOLE WITH FREE POINT AND CCL.
8:30 9:00 0.50 61ABND LOG WLWRK P WORK 9-5/8" CASING FROM 530K UP WT TO 430 DWN WT (1 FOOT OF PIPE

STRECTH) CASING FOUND FREE AT 3,350'
9:00 10:00 1.00 61ABND LOG WLWRK P PULLOUT OF THE HOLE WITH FREE POINT AND CCL.

10:00 10:30 0.50 61ABND FISH OTH P RELEASE SPEAR.

10:30 11:00 0.50 61ABND FISH OTH P LAYDOWN SPEAR.
11:00 11;30 0.50 61ABND LOG RIGUP P RIG DOWN WIRE LINE

11:30 12:00 0.50 61ABND TRIP BHA P MAKE UP 5-9/16" OD INTERNALCASING CUTTER, XO, XO = 7.74'
12:00 15:00 3.00 61ABND TRIP DRILL P RUN INTHE HOLEWITH 5" DRILL PIPE TO 3,007'.
15:00 15:30 0.50 61ABND FISH OTH P OBTAINPARAMETERS UP WT 140K DWN WT 140K ROT WT 140K. BEGIN

CUTTING 9-5/8" CASINGWITH 60 RPM, OTQ, 84 GPM, 550 PSI.
CASING CUT @ 3,00T

15:30 17:30 2.00 61ABND CIRC CNDFLD P CIRCULATE @ 276 GPM 609 PSI. MIXAND PUMP DRY JOB.

17:30 19:00 1.50 61ABND TRIP DRILL P PULL OUT OF THE HOLE.
19:00 19:30 0.50 61ABND FISH OTH P LAY DOWN CASING CUTTER

19:30 20:00 0.50 61ABND FISH OTH P MAKEUP 7-1/4" SPEAR, DRESSED WITH 8.688" GRAPPLE.
20:00 20:30 0.50 61ABND FISH OTH P EN GAUGE 9-5/8" MANDRELHANGER AND PULLTO THE RIG FLOOR. UP WT.

220K.
20:30 22:30 2.00 61ABND CIRC CNDFLD P CIRCULATE@256 GPM, 766 PSI WHILE RIGGING UP WEATHERFORD TRS

CASING CREW.
22:30 23:30 1.00 61ABND TRIP BHA P RELEASE 7-1/4" SPEAR AND LAY DOWN, BREAKAND LAYDOWN 9-5/8" MANDREL

HANGERWITH9-5/8" PACK OFF.

23:30 0:00 0.50 61ABND CSG RIGUP P RIG UP WEATHERFORD TRS LAYDOWN TRUCK.

Total Time 24.00

Safety Incident? N Days since Last RI: 93.00 Weather Comments:
Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 93.00 CLEAR AND 19 DEG.

Incident Comments:
No incidents reported last 24 hours.
Pit drillheld. Reaction time 1 min 20 sec.
Other Remarks: DIESEL USED - 1696 GALS; DIESEL ON HAND - 8480 GALS; DIESEL RECEIVED - 0 GALS.

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS.

HOLE TOOK 0 BBLS MUD IN LAST 24 HOURS.
TOTAL LOSSES FOR SECTION O BBLS

THIRD PARTY PERSONAL SIGNED IN = 12
DAYCREW - FULL.
NIGHT CREW FULL.

1/12/2009 6:53:06AM Page 2 of



CONFIDENTIAL
DAILYOPERATIOoNS

ARTNERREPORT
PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 01/10/2009

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 107

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINAL KB @7,920.00ft DFS: 71.19
Today's MD: 3,000.0 ft Progress: 3.000.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:

Prev MD: 3,000.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 0.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Ava ROP Todav: 0.0 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:
Current Formation: KAIBAB@11,230.0 Lithology:

Current Ops: NIPPLING DOWN BOP
24-Hr Summary: L/D 9-5/8 CASING, PUMP CEMENTABANDONMENT

g4] o¡ne*Î NIPPLE DOWN BOP. REMOVE A &B SECTION
CASINGIWELL CONTROL HOOKLOAD&TOROUE HYDRAULICS MUDGAS Ava Max

Last Casing: 9.675in @10,260ft Str Wt UplDn: / Pump Rate: 209.3 Conn:

Next Casing: 5.500\n g 14,000ft Str Wt Rot: Pump Press: 100.0 Trip:
Last BOP Press Test: 12/18/2008 Torg Off Btm: Backgr:

Form Test/EMW: LOT / 14.05 ppg Torq On Btm:

PERSONNEL SURVEY DATA(LAST 6)

Supervisor 1: WADE FRAME MD Incl Azi TVD NI-S El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2: 11,288.0 0.00 12.36 11,287.15 41.7 -5.3 41.9 2.61 -2.61

Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 11,192.0 2.51 313.53 11,191.18 40.3 -3.8 40.2 1.26 -0.09

Geoloqigt: KIRK SPARKMAN 11,096.0 2.60 340.82 11,095.27 36.8 -1.5 36.4 0.83 0.48
Oxy Personnel: 0 11,000.0 2.14 356.82 10,999.35 32.9 -0.7 32.4 0.58 0.32
Contractor Personnel: 17 10,906.0 1.84 9.96 10.905.41 29.7 -0.9 29.3 0.06 0.00
Total on Site: 17 10.905.0 1.84 9.98 10 904.41 29.6 -0.9 29.2 1.62 1.62

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD in MD Out 1-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code

BIT OPERATING PARAMETERSTODAY
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

MUDDATA - NE NPARK-AVA LAST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: SCOTT JONES / JASON MOO MBT: 17.5 lbm/bbl
Sample From: PIT pH: 9.6
Mud Type: FRESH WATER POLYMER M Pm / Pom: Comoonent OD ID Jts Lenath
Time / MD: 0:01 / 3,000.0 Pf / Mf: 0.3 / 0.5
Density @Temp: 9.60 / 56 Chlorides: 3,400 DRILLPIPE
Rheology Temp: 120 Ca+ / K+: / CROSSOVER 6.25C 2.375 1 2.17

Viscosity: 58.00 CaCl2: CROSSOVER 5.625 2.375 1 1.61
PV I YP: 20 / 13 Clom: CUTTER 5.625 2.750 1 3,96
Gels 10s/10m/30m: 7 / 14 / 20 Lime:
API WL: 14.20 ES:
HTHP WL: ECD:
Cake API I HTHP: 2.0 / nl K: /
Solids / Sol Corr: 5.00 / 4.90 Carbonate:
Oil / Water: 0.0 / 95.0 Bicarbonate:
Sand: 0.25 Form Loss: 0.0 / 2,773.0
Water Added: Fluid Disch: /
Oil Added:
LGS: 0.60 / 5.10
VG Meter: 3@3 / 6@6 / 13@100 / 21@,200 / 33@300 / 53@600
Comments: R\GGED UP CASING LAY-DOWN CREW. LAYEDDOWN
THE 9-5/8" LANDINGJOINT, MANDREL HANGER, AND9-5/8" CASING
JOINTS. PUMPED BALANCEDPLUGS AT CASING CUTTINGPOINT.

MUDPR( DUCTS

Product Units Qty Used
ENG 24 HR#1 1 1.00 RECEIVED
ENG 24 HR #2 1 1.00

JAN2 0 2009

0 GILGAS&MNNG

1/12/2009 6:55:15AM Page 1 of



OXY USA

DAILYOPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 01/10/2009

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 107
I

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Type
0:00 1:00 1.00 61ABND CSG RIGUP P RIG UP WEATHERFORD TRS LAYDOWNTRUCK.
1:00 6:00 5.00 61ABND ABDN PULCSG P LAYDOWN 9-5/8" CASING.

6:00 6:30 0.50 61ABND ABDN PULCSG P LAYDOWN 9-5/8" CASING. RECOVERED 73 JOINTS PLUS 18.5" CUT OFF JOINT =

2966.74'
6:30 8:00 1.50 61ABND CSG RIGUP P RIG DOWN CASING EQUIPMENT.
8:00 9:00 1.00 61ABND TRIP CMT P RUN INTHE HOLEWITH 5" DRILL PIPE TO 2900'.

9:00 11:45 2.75 61ABND CMT RIGUP P RIG UP HALLIBURTON
11:45 12:00 0.25 61ABND SAFE PJSM P PRE JOB SAFETY MEETING.
12:00 12:30 0.50 61ABND CMT PLUG P TEST LINES TO 3500 PSI, PUMP 20 BBLS WATER, 52 BBLS 15.8 PPG, 254 SX OF

CEMENT, 2.7 BBLS OF WATER AND DISPLACE WITH 42.4 BBLS OF 9.7 PPG MUD.
CALCULATEDTOP OF CEMENT AT 2,559'.

12:30 12:45 0.25 61ABND TRIP CMT P PULLOUT OF THE HOLE TO 2,413'.

12:45 14:00 1.25 61ABND CIRC CNDFLD P CIRCULATEAT 209 GPM, 100 PSI. RIG DOWN HALLIBURTONAND RIG UP
WEATHERFORD TRS LAY DOWN TRUCK.

14:00 16:30 2.50 61ABND TRIP PULD P LAYDOWN DRILLPIPE.
16:30 17:00 0.50 61ABND SRFEQ RIGUP P RIG DOWNWEATHERFORD TRS LAYDOWNTRUCK.

17:00 17:30 0.50 61ABND TRIP PULD P RUN IN THE HOLE WITHEXCESS DRILLPIPE TO 2375'.
17:30 18:00 0.50 61ABND SRFEQ RIGUP P RIG UP WEATHERFORD TRS LAY DOWNTRUCK.

18:00 20:00 2.00 61ABND TR\P PULD P LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE 32 STANDS, 96 JOINTS.

20:00 20:30 0.50 61ABND TRIP PULD P RUN INTHE HOLEWITH EXCESS DRILLPIPE TO 665'.

20:30 21:00 0.50 61ABND TRIP PULD P LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE, 7 STANDS, 21 JOINTS.

21:00 22:00 1.00 61ABND SRFEQ RIGUP P RIG DOWNWEATHERFORD TRS LAYDOWN TRUCK.
22:00 0:00 2.00 61ABND BOP RDBOP P NIPPLE DOWN DRILLING RISER.

Total Time 24.00
Safety Incident7 N Days since Last RI: 94.00 Weather Comments:

Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 94.00 OVER CAST, 29 DEG, N WIND @ 20 MPH.
Incident Comments:
No incidents reported last 24 hours.1 Hot work permit issued

Other Remarks: DIESEL USED - 1908 GALS; DIESEL ON HAND- 6572 GALS; DIESEL RECEIVED - 0 GALS.

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS.

THIRD PARTY PERSONAL SIGNED IN = 6
DAYCREW - FULL.
NIGHT CREW FULL.
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CONFIDENTIALDAILY OPERATIONS7ARTNER REPORT
PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL35-1 Date: 01/11/2009

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 108

Wellbore: 00 Rig: NABORS 797 Ref Datum: ORIGINALKB @7,920.00ft DFS: 72.19
Today's MD: 3,000.0 ft Progress: 3,000.0 ft Ground Elev: 7,885.00 ft Daily Cost:

Prev MD: 3,000.0 ft Rot Hrs Today: 0.00 hr AFE MDIDays: 14,000.0 / 98.0 days Cum Cost:
PBMD: Ava ROP Todav: 0.0 ft/hr AFE Number: 94370114 AFE Cost:

Current Formation: KAIBAB@11,230.0 Lithology:

Current Ops: RIG RELEASED FROM PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1
24-Hr Summary: NIPPLE DOWN BOP, PUMP SURFACE ABANDONMENT
74-Q o¶ecast PERPARE TO MOVE RIG TO BURRVILLE

CASINGlWELLCONTROL HOOKLOAD & TOROUE HYDRAULICS MUD GAS Ava Max
Last Casing: 9.675tn @10,260ft Str Wt UplDn: / Pump Rate: 0.0 Conn:

Next Casing: 5.500in @ 14,000ft Str Wt Rot: Pump Press: 0.0 Trip:

Last BOP Press Test: 12/18/2008 Torg Off Btm: Backgr:

Form Test/EMW: LOT / 14.05 ppg forq On Btm:
PERSONNEL SURVEYDATA(LAST 6)

Supervisor 1: WADE FRAME MD Incl Azi TVD NI-S El-W VS DLS Build
Supervisor 2: 11,288.0 0.00 12.36 11,287.15 41.7 -5.3 41.9 2.61 -2.61

Engineer: RUSTY HANNA 11,192.0 2.51 313.53 11,191.18 40.3 -3.8 40.2 1.26 -0.09

Geplogist: KIRKSPARKMAN 11,096.0 2.60 340.82 11,095.27 36.8 -1.5 36.4 0.83 0.48

Oxy Personnel: 0 11,000.0 2.14 356.82 10,999.35 32.9 -0.7 32.4 0.58 0.32
Contractor Personnel: 17 10,906.0 1.84 9.96 10,905.41 29.7 -0.9 29.3 0.06 0.00
Total on Site: 17 10.905.0 1.84 9.98 10 904.41 29.6 -0.9 29.2 1.62 1.62

BIT RECORD
Bit No Size Manufacturer Model Serial No IADC Nozzles MD In MD Out I-O-D-L B-G-O-R

Code

BIT OPERATING PARAMETERS TODAY
Bit No Rot Cum Rot Prog Cum Prog ROP Cum ROP WOB RPM TFA P Drop Bit Noz Vel HHPSI

Hrs Hrs min/max min/max

MUD DATA - LAST OR CURRENT BHA
Engineer: MBT:
Sample From: pH:
Mud Type: Pm I Pom:
Time / MD: / Pf / Mf: /

Comoonent OD ID Jts Lenath

Density @Temp: / Chlorides: DRILLPIPE
Rheology Temp: Ca+ l K+: / CROSSOVER 6.25C 2.375 1 2.17
Viscosity: CaCl2: CROSSOVER 5.625 2.375 1 1.61
PV I YP: / Clom: CUTTER 5.625 2.750 1 3.96
Gels 10s/10m/30m: / / Lime:
API WL: ES:
HTHP WL: ECD:
CakeAPilHTHP: / n/K: /
Solids / Sol Corr: / Carbonate:
Oil I Water: / Bicarbonate.
Sand: Form Loss: 0.0 / 2,773.0
Water Added: Fluid Disch: /
Oil Added:
LGS: /
VG Meter:
Comments:

Product MIIDPanotici"..,,, o,,s... RECEIVED
ENG 24 HR #1 1 1.00
ENG24HR#2 1 1.00 JAN2 0 2009

&MINING

1/12/2009 6:55:30AM Page 1 of



OXY USA

DAILYOPERATIONS PARTNER REPORT
Event: EXPL DRILLING PLATEAUVALLEYFEDERAL 35-1 Date: 01/11/2009
Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILLVERT USA Report No: 108

i

OPERATIONS
From To Hrs Op Op Op Op Operation Details

Phase Code Sub Tvoe

0:00 6:00 6.00 61ABND BOP RDBOP P NIPPLE DOWN BOP.
6:00 11:00 5.00 61ABND BOP RDBOP P NIPPLE DOWN BOP AND "B" SECTION.

BEGIN CLEANINGMUDTANKS.
11:00 11:30 0.50 61ABND TRIP CMT P RUN IN THE HOLE TO 186'. RIG UP HALLIBURTON.

11:30 11:45 0.25 61ABND SAFE PJSM P PRE JOB SAFETY MEETING.
11:45 12:15 0.50 61ABND CMT PLUG P TEST LINES TO 3500 PSI, PUMP 20 BBLS OF FRESH WATER, 21.5 BBLS OF 15.8

PPG CEMENT, 105 SACKS, PUMP .5 BBLS OF FRESH WATER.
12:15 12:30 0.25 61ABND TRIP CMT P PULL OUT OF THE HOLE.

TOP OF CEMENT 13' BELOW GROUND LEVEL.
12:30 17:00 4.50 61ABND CMT WOC P WOC.

MUD TANKS CLEANED.
17:00 19:00 2.00 61ABND ABDN OTHER P REMOVE "A" SECTION FROM 9-5/8" CASING.

19:00 21:30 2.50 61ABND ABDN OTHER P CUT 9-5/8" AND 20" 3.5' BELOW GROUND LEVEL,WELD ON 20" ABANDOMENT LID
WITH WELL INFORMATION.

21:30 22:00 0.50 61ABND TRIP PULD P LAYDOWN DRILLPIPE (2 STANDS)
RIG RELEASED FROM PLATEAUVALLEY FEDERAL 35-1 @22:00 HOURS ON
01-11-2009

Total Time 22.00

Safety Incident? N Days since Last RI: 95.00 Weather Comments:

Environ Incident? N Days since Last LTA: 95.00 CLEAR AND 28 DEG.

Incident Comments:
No incidents reported last 24 hours. 1 Safe work permit issued. 1
Hot work permit issued. 1 confined space permit issued.
Other Remarks: DIESEL USED - 1,060 GALS; DIESEL ON HAND - 5,512 GALS; DIESEL RECEIVED - 0 GALS.

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS.

THIRD PARTY PERSONAL SIGNED IN = 8
DAY CREW - FULL.
NIGHT CREW FULL.
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00NFllENTAL
Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES OOM API

-

3D7
(August 2007)

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires: July 31, 2010
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

UTU-81364
SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6.IfIndian, AllotteeorTribeName

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an N/A
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on page 2. 7. If Unit of CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
N/A1. Type of Well
8. Well Name and No.Oil Well O Gas Well Other Plateau Valley Federal 35-1

2. Name of Operator 9. API Well No.
OXY USAlnc. 4304130060

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. {include area code) 10. Field and Pool or Exploratory Area
ouston TX

77227-7757
(970) 263-3637 Exploratory

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T.,R.,M, or Survey Description) 11. Country or Parish, State
Section 35, Township 25 South, Range i West, SLB&M
At surface: 868' FNL, 734' FEL, being in NE4NE4 At prod. zone: 868' FNL, 734' FEL, being in NE4NE4 Sevier, UT (041)

12. CHECK THE APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) WaterShut-Off

O sitercasing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon
Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation: Clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof. If
the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports must be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 must be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices must be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

OXY USA Inc. (OXY) is providing subsequent report of plug and abandonment operations on the Plateau Valley Federal 35-1 well. OXY set a total of 5 plugs
at this location on January 9, 2009. The method of plug placement was using balanced cement plugs. The plugs were set at depths of 11,200', 10,226',
7,000', 2900-2559', and from 140' below ground to the surface. The 53.5 lb, 9 5/8" casing was mechanically cut at a depth of 2966' and removed. 8.7 Ib/gallon
mud was left in the casing from a depth of 2966' down to TD. Verbal approval for the plug and abandonment of the Plateau Valley Federal 35-1 well was
received by Al McKee with the BLMon January 3, 2009. OXY will comply with all reclamation requirements and notify the BLM when the site is ready for final
inspection.

RECEIVED
JAN2O2009

DIV,0FOIL,GAS&MINING
niSelreby certi Name (Printed/Typed)

Ditle Reg atory Coordinator

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE
Approved by

Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or certify
that the applicant holds legalor equitable title to thoserights in the subject lease which would Office
entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false,
fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
(Instructions on page





United States Department of the
Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT M
Richfield Field Office

150East 900 North
Richfield, Utah 84701
http://www.blm.gov

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3160
UTOSO

October 7, 2008

Daniel I. Padilla
Regulatory Coordinator
OXYUSA, Inc.
P.O. Box 27570
Houston, Texas 77227-7757

Re: Well No. Plateau Valley Federal 35-1 Ô'O
SW¼NE¼, Section/T. 25 S., R. 1 W., SLB&M
Sevier County, Utah
Lease No. UTU-81364

Gentlemen:

This correspondence is in regard to the self-certification statement submitted requesting
a change in operator for the referenced well. After a review by this office, the change in
operator request is approved. Effective immediately, OXY USA, Inc. is responsible for
all operations performed on the referenced well. All liabilitywillnow fall under your
bond, BLM Bond No. ESO136, for all operations conducted on the referenced wellon the
leased land.

Ifyou have any other questions concerning this matter, please contact Pam Hart of this
officeat (435) 896-1590.

Sincerely,

ornell M. Christensen
Field Office Manager

cc: UDOGM
RECEIVED
OCT1 'O2008

D1V.OFOlL,GAS&



Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES OMRB 3D7
(August 2007)

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires: July 31, 2010
BUREAU OF LAND Mg18gEggT- 5 L s8e1SenalNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND g2QRTS ON WELLS 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
Do not use this form forpropo N ÑrBÑorMrÑéritr an N/A

abandoned we/I. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on page 2. 7. If Unit of CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well FI/A

Oil Well Gas WeH Q Other NËlÎeaydFeNdáral
35-1

2. Name of Operator 9. API Well No.
OXY USA Inc. (OXY) . 4304130060

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool or Exploratory Area

ouston
T7X77577227-7757

(970) 263-3637 Exploratory
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T.,R.,M, or SurveyDescription) 1I. Country or Parish, State
Section 35, Township 25 South, Range 1 West, SLB&M
At surface: 868' FNL, 734' FEL, being in NE4NE4 At prod. zone: 868' FNL, 734' FEL, being in NE4NE4 Sevier, UT (041)

12. CHECK THE APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation WeH Integrhy

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Operatorchange

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon
Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation: Clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof. If
the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports must be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 must be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices must be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

OXY USA Inc. (OXY) is providing notice that the operator of the Plateau Valley Federal 35-1 well has changed from Wolverine Operating Company of Utah,
LLC to OXY. OX¥ requests the effective date to occur on or around September 24, 2008. As part of the operator transfer, OXY has reviewed and accepts the
conditions of approvalas issued on June 25, 2008 by Wayne Wetzel of the Richfield Field Office of the BLM. OXY's existing BLM/BIABond No. is ES 0136.
OXY's Utah oiland gas operator number is NO416. Also, OXY has provided the Utah Oil and Gas Commission a copy of the Notice of Intent.

Self-Certification Statement:

Under the Federal regulations in effect as of June 15, 1988, an operator is now required to submit a self-certification statement to the appropriate Bureau
office stating that said operator has the right to operate upon the leasehold premises. Said notification may be in the following format:

"Please be advised that OXY USA Inc. is considered to be the operator of Well No. Plateau Valley Federal 35-1; NE1/4 NE1/4, Section 35, Township 25S,
Range 1W; Lease UTU-81364 ; Sevier County, UT; and is responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease for the operations conducted upon the
leased lands. Bond coverage is provided by ES 0136."

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct. Name (Printed/Typed)

Daniel I. Padilla Title Regulatory Coordinator

Signature Date

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Title Date
Òo app are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or certify
that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would Office
entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

_ .
L .

Title 18 U S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section1212, make it a crime for any person kAowinglyand willfully to make to any department or agency alse,
fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to ally matter within its jurisdiction.
(Instructions on page 2)

DlV.0FOIL,GAS&



STATE OF UTAH E REPORT Ü FORM 8
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES ( i hanges)

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING . E D IGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
- 4

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

1a. TYPE OF WELL: ELLL GAESLL DRY OTHER 7. UNI r CA AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
NEEWL OR DNEEP- RNETRY DREFSFŸR.

OTHER Plateau Valley Federal 35-1
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

OXY USA Inc. 4304130060
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT

P.O. Box 27757 ciTv Houston STATE TX ZIP 77227 (970) 263-3629 Exploratory
4. LOCATIONOF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

ATSURFACE: 868' FNL, 734' FEL, being in the NE4NE4 MERIDIA :

NENE 35 25S 1W S
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVALREPORTED BELOW: 868' FNL, 734' FEL, being in NE4NE4

12. COUNTY 13. STATE
ATTOTALDEPTH: ' FNL, 73 FEL, being in NE4NE4 S UTAH

14.9D/A26E/S2POUDD8ED: 15. DME T DO9REACHED: 16. D TE C P
ABANDONED READYTO PRODUCE

17. ELEVATIONSLDF R9K20RTGKL

18. TOTAL DEPTH: MD 11,450 19. PLUG BACKT.D.: MD 3,000 20. IF MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS, HOW MANY? * 21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD
PLUG SET:

TVD 11.449 TVD 3,000 TVD

22. TYPE ELECTRICAND OTHER MECHANICALLOGS RUN (Submit copy of each) 23.

WAS WELL CORED7 NO YES (Submit analysis)Sonic, velocity, side well cores, micro log, Gamma ray log,
. WAS DST RUN7 NO YES (Submit report)resistivity, density, porosity

DIRECTIONALSURVEY7 NO YES (Submit copy)

24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in well)

HOLE SIZE SIZEIGRADE WEIGHT (#lft.) TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) STAGEDCEMHENTER CNEMEONFSACKES VOLSUM
BBL) CEMENT TOP ** AMOUNTPULLED

46" 40" N96 159 35 65 G 45 15 35 0
26" 20" J55 78.6 35 1,135 G 884 294 35 0
17.5" 13.37" J55 68 35 2,809 Versati 1,5g 633 35 0
12.25" 9.625" HCP 53.5 35 10,226 G 1,5g 429 3350 3000

25. TUBING RECORD

SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

NA
26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD

FORMATIONNAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM (TVD) INTERVAL(Top/Bot - MD) SIZE NO. HOLES PERFORATIONSTATUS

(A) NA DPen Squeezed

(B) Open Squeezed

(C) Open Squeezed

(D) Open Squeezed

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC,

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNTAND TYPE OF MATERIAL

NA

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

ELECTRICAL/MECHANICALLOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONALSURVEY P &AO SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGINGAND CEMENT VERIFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER:

(5/2000) (CONTINUEDON BACK) FEB18 2009
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



31. INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVALA (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OlL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES:

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER- BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES:

INTERVALB (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES:

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER- BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES:

INTERVALC (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES:

CHOKE SlZE: BG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER- BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES:

INTERVALD (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES:

CHOKE SIZE: BG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER- BBL: INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES:

32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

NA
33. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION (Log) MARKERS:

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Formation Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (Measu
edpDepth)

Volcanics 0
Tertiary 2,580
Arapien Shale 4,720
Top Twin Creek 5,462
Top Navajo 5,755
Top Chinle 7,356
Top Moenkopi 7,810
Top Sinbad Member 9,620
Top Black Dragon 9,846
Top Kaibab 10,148

35. ADDITIONAL REMARK: (Include plugging procedure)

Additional formation markers - Top Toroweap = 10,510' Top White Rim = 10,688' Top Pakoon = 11,099'

36. I hereby certîfy that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Daniel I. Padilla TITLE Regulatory Coordinator

SIGNATURE - DATE

This report must be submitted within 30 days of
• completing or plugging a new well • reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
• drillinghorizontal laterals from an existing well bore • significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
• recompleting to a different producing formation • drillinghydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from twoor more formations.

**lTEM24: Cement Top -Show how reported top(s)of cement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL), cement bond log (CBL),temperaturesurvey (TS)).

Send to: Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801



Schlumberger
6501 S. Fiddler's Green Circle, Suite 400 e

Greenwood Village, CO 80111
(303) 486-3200

SUB-SURFACE
SURVEY CERTIFICATION REPORT

Occidental January 16, 2009
Company Date

Plateau Valley 35-1 Sevier, UT
Lease ' County/State

Survey Depths 1174 to 11288 ft

Type of Survey Measurements While Drilling (MWD)

Survey Depths 11288 11452 ft

Type of Survey Projection to Bit

Survey Depths to ft

Type of Survey

Site Supervisor Tandy Dillen

The data submitted in this report conforms to the standards and procedures as set
forth by Schlumberger. This report represents a trueand correct directional wellbore
survey based on originalsurvey data obtained at the well site.

Ed Moore
Drilling Engineer

This document has been subscribed and affirmed, or sworn before me in the county of
Arapahoe in the state of Colorado, this o9 day of « ¾ , 201.

My commision expires: fo2 ·/Ÿ d

Op



SchlumbergerPlateau Valley 354 Final Surveys Report ca Y
ReportDate: January 16,2009 Surveyl DLSComputationMethod: MinimumCurvature! Lubinski

Client: Oxy Vertical SectionAzimuth: 360 000°

Field: UT.SevierCounty(NAD27 UtState Planes CZUSFeet) VerticalSection Origin: N0.000ft E 0.000 ft
Structure/ Slot: Plateau Valley35-1/ Plateau Valley35-1 TVDReferenceDatum: RKB

Weil: Plateau Valley35-1 TVDReferenceElevation: 7920.1ft relativetoMSL
Borehole: OriginalHole Sea Bed/ Ground LevelElevation: 7885.530ft relativetoMSL
UWI/APl#: MagneticDeclination: 12.132°

Survey NamelDate: Plateau Valley35-1FinalSurveys(Gyro+MWD)O'to11452'/ October27, 2008 TotalFieldStrength: 51431.156nT
Tort/AHDl DDI/ ERDratio: 35.461°!83.46 ftl 3.471/ 0.007 MagneticDip: 64.325°

GridCoordinateSystem: NAD27UtahState Planes, CentralZone. USFeet Declination Date: October31,2008
LocationLatlLong: N 3835 49.358,W 11152 8.899 MagneticDeclination Model: BGGM2008

LocationGridNIEYlX: N96274.044ftUS.E 1894479.747ftUS NorthReference: GridNorth
Grid Convergence Angle: -0.23646232° TotalCorrMagNorth-> GridNorth: +12.368°

Grid ScaleFactor: 1.00012992 LocalCoordinates ReferencedTo: WellHead

Comments Inclination Azimuth TVD Vc NS EW DLS Noithing Easting Latitude Longitude

(ft) (deq) (deg) (It) (It\ (ft) (It) (deqM00ft) (ftBS) (ItBS)

Surface 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 96274.04 1894479.75 N 38 35 49.358 W 111 52 8.899
Begin Gyro Surveys 100.00 0.14 246.40 100.00 -0.05 -0.05 -0.11 0.14 96274.00 1894479.64 N 38 35 49.358 W 111 52 8.901

200.00 0.05 284.15 200.00 -0.09 -0.09 -0.27 0.11 96273.96 1894479.48 N 38 35 49.358 W 111 52 8.902
300.00 0.03 247,90 300.00 -0.09 -0.09 -0,33 0.03 96273.96 1894479,41 N 38 35 49.358 W 111 52 8.903
400.00 0.11 271.67 400.00 -0.09 -0.09 -0.45 0.08 96273.95 1894479.29 N 38 35 49.358 W 111 52 8.905

500,00 0.07 239.01 500.00 -0.12 -0.12 -0.60 0.06 96273.92 1894479.15 N 38 35 49.357 W 111 52 8.907
600.00 0.05 279.81 600.00 -0.15 -0.15 -0.70 0.05 96273.90 1894479.05 N 38 35 49.357 W 111 52 8.908
700.00 0.09 358.94 700.00 -0.06 -0.06 -0.74 0.09 96273.98 1894479.01 N 38 35 49.358 W 111 52 8.908
800.00 0.21 47.21 800.00 0.14 0.14 -0.61 0.16 96274.19 1894479.14 N 38 35 49.360 W 111 52 8.907
900.00 0.08 20.48 900.00 0.33 0.33 -0.45 0.14 96274.38 1894479.30 N 38 35 49.362 W 111 52 8.905

Last Gyro Survey 990.00 0.22 349.17 990.00 0.56 0.56 -0.46 0.17 96274.61 1894479.29 N 38 35 49.364 W 111 52 8.905
Begin SLB MWD Surveys 1174.00 0.12 351.99 1174.00 1.10 1.10 -0.55 0.05 96275.14 1894479.19 N 38 35 49.369 W 111 52 8.906

1301.00 0.04 89.98 1301.00 1.23 1.23 -0.53 0.10 96275.28 1894479.22 N 38 35 49.371 W 111 52 8.906
1396.00 0.06 316.11 1396.00 1.27 1.27 -0.53 0.10 96275.31 1894479.22 N 38 35 49.371 W 111 52 8.906
1490.00 0.03 114.92 1490.00 1.29 1.29 -0.54 0.09 96275.34 1894479.21 N 38 35 49.371 W 111 52 8.906

1585.00 0.03 171.18 1585.00 1.26 1.26 -0.51 0.03 96275.30 1894479.23 N 38 35 49.371 W 111 52 8.906
1679.00 0.03 224.68 1679.00 1.21 1.21 -0.53 0.03 96275.26 1894479.22 N 38 35 49.370 W 111 52 8.906
1775.00 0.06 285.56 1775.00 1.21 1.21 -0.59 0.05 96275.25 1894479.15 N 38 35 49.370 W 111 52 8.907
1871.00 0.06 4.81 1871.00 1.27 1.27 -0.64 0.08 96275.32 1894479.11 N 38 35 49.371 W 111 52 8.907
1966.00 0.06 15.47 1966.00 1.37 1.37 -0.62 0.01 96275 42 1894479.13 N 38 35 49.372 W 111 52 8.907

2060.00 0.03 77.91 2060.00 1,42 1.42 -0,58 0.06 96275.47 1894479-16 N 38 35 49,373 W 111 52 8,907
2156.00 0.09 42.47 2156.00 1.49 1.49 -0.51 0.07 96275.53 1894479.24 N 38 35 49.373 W 111 52 8.906
2252.00 0.04 13.73 2252.00 1.57 1.57 -0.45 0.06 96275.62 1894479.30 N 38 35 49.374 W 111 52 8.905
2347.00 0.04 13.52 2347.00 1.64 1.64 -0.43 0.00 96275.68 1894479.31 N 38 35 49.375 W 111 52 8.905
2443.00 0.00 12.15 2443.00 1.67 1.67 -0.43 0.04 96275,71 1894479.32 N 38 35 49.375 W 111 52 8.905

2536.00 0.04 313.11 2536.00 1.69 1.69 -0.45 0.04 96275.74 1894479.30 N 38 35 49.375 W 111 52 8.905
2631,00 0.06 349.56 2631.00 1.76 1.76 -0.48 0.04 96275.81 1894479.26 N 38 35 49.376 W 111 52 8.905
2726.00 0.06 250.09 2726.00 1.80 1.80 -0.54 0.10 96275.84 1894479.21 N 38 35 49.376 W 111 52 8.906

13 3/8" Casing Point 2809.00 0.09 213.52 2809.00 1.73 1.73 -0.61 0.06 96275.77 1894479.13 N 38 35 49.376 VV111 52 8.907
2871.00 0.12 200.66 2871.00 1.63 1.63 -0.66 0.06 96275,67 1894479.08 N 38 35 49.375 W 111 52 8.908

2967.00 0.09 119.57 2967.00 1.50 1.50 -0.63 0.14 96275.54 1894479.11 N 38 35 49.373 W 111 52 8.907
3061.00 0.09 265.80 3061.00 1.46 1.46 -0.64 0.18 96275,50 1894479.10 N 38 35 49.373 W 111 52 8.907
3155.00 0.09 166.96 3155.00 1.38 1.38 -0.70 0.15 96275.42 1894479.05 N 38 35 49.372 W 111 52 8.908
3249.00 0.12 236.30 3249.00 1.25 1.25 -0.76 0.13 96275.30 1894478.98 N 38 35 49.371 W 111 52 8.909
3344.00 0.29 246.21 3344.00 1.10 1.10 -1.07 0.18 96275.14 1894478.68 N 38 35 49.369 W 111 52 8.913

3440.00 0.18 165.47 3440.00 0.85 0.85 -1.25 0.33 96274.90 1894478.50 N 38 35 49.367 W 111 52 8.915
3534.00 0.13 85.75 3534.00 0.72 0.72 -1.11 0.22 96274.76 1894478.64 N 38 35 49.366 W 111 52 8.913
3628.00 0.03 193.57 3627.99 0.70 0.70 -1.01 0.15 96274.75 1894478.74 N 38 35 49.365 W 111 52 8.912
3723.00 0.16 22.22 3722.99 0.80 0.80 -0.96 0,20 96274.85 1894478.78 N 38 35 49,366 W 111 52 8.911
3817.00 0.12 95.31 3816.99 0.91 0.91 -0.82 0.18 96274.96 1894478.93 N 38 35 49.367 W 111 52 8.909

3911.00 0.09 335.73 3910.99 0.97 0.97 -0.75 0.19 96275.02 1894479.00 N 38 35 49.368 W 111 52 8.909
4006.00 0.25 347.87 4005.99 1.24 1.24 -0.82 0.17 96275.29 1894478.92 N 38 35 49.371 W 111 52 8.910
4099.00 0.40 335.02 4098.99 1.74 1.74 -1.00 0.18 96275.78 1894478.74 N 38 35 49.376 W 111 52 8.912
4195.00 0.55 309.18 4194.99 2.33 2.33 -1.50 0.27 96276.38 1894478.25 N 38 35 49.381 W 111 52 8.918
4291.00 0.59 302.41 4290.98 2.89 2.89 -2.28 0.08 96276.93 1894477.47 N 38 35 49.387 W 111 52 8.928

4386.00 0.57 294.11 4385.98 3.34 3.34 -3.12 0.09 96277.39 1894476.63 N 38 35 49.391 W 111 52 8.939
4482.00 0.48 314.72 4481.98 3.82 3.82 -3.84 0.22 96277.86 1894475.91 N 38 35 49.396 W 111 52 8.948
4575.00 0.56 322.55 4574.97 4.46 4.46 -4.39 0.11 96278.50 1894475.35 N 38 35 49.402 W 111 52 8.955
4671.00 0.79 337.27 4670.97 5.44 5.44 -4.94 0.30 96279.48 1894474.81 N 38 35 49.412 W 111 52 8.962
4766.00 1.27 326.93 4765.95 6.92 6.92 -5.76 0.54 96280.97 1894473.98 N 38 35 49.427 W 111 52 8.972

4861.00 1.42 318.37 4860.92 8.69 8.69 -7.12 0.26 96282.73 1894472.63 N 38 35 49.444 W 111 52 8.989
4956.00 1.22 314.31 4955.90 10.27 10.27 -8.62 0.23 96284.32 1894471.12 N 38 35 49.460 W 111 52 9.008
5051.00 1.33 315.08 5050.87 11.76 11.76 -10.13 0.12 96285.81 1894469.62 N 38 35 49.474 W 111 52 9.027
5135.00 1.43 307.75 5134.85 13.09 13.09 -11.64 0.24 96287.14 1894468.10 N 38 35 49.487 W 111 52 9.046
5229.00 0.06 221.55 5228.84 13.77 13.77 -12.60 1.52 96287.82 1894467.14 N 38 35 49.494 W 111 52 9.059

5325.00 0.06 353.11 5324.84 13.79 13.79 -12.64 0.11 96287.83 1894467,10 N 38 35 49.494 W 111 52 9.059
5421.00 0.09 222.16 5420.84 13.78 13.78 -12.70 0.14 96287.83 1894467.05 N 38 35 49.494 W 111 52 9.060
5515.00 0.09 47.21 5514.84 13.77 13.77 -12.70 0.19 96287.82 1894467.05 N 38 35 49.494 W 111 52 9.060
5611.00 0.10 335.48 5610.84 13.90 13.90 -12.67 0.12 96287.95 1894467.07 N 38 35 49.495 W 111 52 9.060
5707.00 0.14 56.93 5706.84 14.04 14.04 -12.61 0.17 96288.09 1894467.13 N 38 35 49.497 W 111 52 9.059
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Comments Inclination Azimuth TVD ec
NS EW DLS Northing Easting Latitude Longitude

(ft) (deq) (deg) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (degl100ft) (ftUS) (ftUS)

5802.00 0.04 29.89 5801.84 14 13 14.13 -12.50 0.11 96288.18 1894467.25 N 38 35 49.498 W 111 52 9.057
5898.00 0.12 329.89 5897.84 14.25 14.25 -12.53 0.11 96288.30 1894467.21 N 38 35 49.499 W 111 52 9.058
5993.00 0.15 330.73 5992.84 14.45 14.45 -12.64 0.03 96288.49 1894467.10 N 38 35 49.501 W 111 52 9.059
6088.00 0.30 114.40 6087.84 14.45 14.45 -12.48 0.45 96288.50 1894467.27 N 38 35 49.501 W 111 52 9.057
6183.00 1.04 243.00 6182.83 13.96 13.96 -13.02 1.32 96288.00 1894466.73 N 38 35 49.496 W 111 52 9.064

6278.00 1.49 261.93 6277.81 13.39 13.39 -15.01 0.64 96287.44 1894464.74 N 38 35 49.490 W 111 52 9.089
6374.00 1.56 277.83 6373.78 13.39 13.39 -17.54 0.45 96287.44 1894462.21 N 38 35 49.490 W 111 52 9.121
6468.00 2.27 296.46 6467.73 14.40 14.40 -20.47 1.00 96288.44 1894459.27 N 38 35 49.500 W 111 52 9.158
6570.00 1.88 297.96 6569.66 16.08 16.08 -23.76 0.39 96290.13 1894455.98 N 38 35 49.516 W 111 52 9.199
6665.00 0.04 71.25 6664.64 16.82 16.82 -25.11 2.01 96290.87 1894454.64 N 38 35 49.524 W 111 52 9.216

6760.00 0.13 309.97 6759.64 16.90 16.90 -25.16 0.16 96290.95 1894454.59 N 38 35 49.525 W 111 52 9.217
6855.00 0.25 335.83 6854.64 17.16 17.16 -25.32 0.15 96291.21 1894454.42 N 38 35 49.527 W 111 52 9.219
7000.00 0.14 22.76 6999.64 17.61 17.61 -25.38 0.13 96291.66 1894454.36 N 38 35 49.532 W 111 52 9.220
7096.00 0.06 16.89 7095.64 17.77 17.77 -25.32 0.08 96291.82 1894454.42 N 38 35 49.533 W 111 52 9.219
7196.00 0.03 10.07 7195.64 17.85 17.85 -25.31 0.03 96291.89 1894454.44 N 38 35 49.534 W 111 52 9.219

7288.00 0.08 337.23 7287.64 17.93 1T93 -25.33 0.06 96291.98 1894454.42 N 38 35 49.535 W 111 52 9.219
7383.00 0.03 327.19 7382.64 18.01 18.01 -25.36 0.05 96292.06 1894454.38 N 38 35 49,535 W 111 52 9.220
7477.00 0.77 25.34 7476.64 18.60 18.60 -25.11 0.80 96292.65 1894454.64 N 38 35 49.541 W 111 52 9.216
7573.00 0.43 34.12 7572.63 19.48 19.48 -24.63 0.37 96293.53 1894455.11 N 38 35 49.550 W 111 52 9.210
7668.00 0.08 114.08 7667.63 19.75 19.75 -24.37 0.45 96293.80 1894455.37 N 38 35 49.553 W 111 52 9.207

7761.00 0.14 92.68 7760.63 19.72 19.72 -24.20 0.08 96293.77 1894455.55 N 38 35 49.552 W 111 52 9.205
7856.00 0.31 83.32 7855.63 19.75 19.75 -23.83 0.18 96293.79 1894455.92 N 38 35 49.553 W 111 52 9.200
7949.00 0.32 108.99 7948.63 19.69 19.69 -23.33 0.15 96293.74 1894456.41 N 38 35 49.552 W 111 52 9.194
8044.00 0.41 116,67 8043.63 19.45 19.45 -22.78 0.11 96293.50 1894456.97 N 38 35 49.550 W 111 52 9.187
8140.00 0.23 120.50 8139.63 19.20 19.20 -22.30 0.19 96293.25 1894457.44 N 38 35 49.547 W 111 52 9.181

8235.00 0.35 88.55 8234.62 19.11 19.11 -21.85 0.21 96293.16 1894457.90 N 38 35 49.546 W 111 52 9.175
8330.00 0.41 73.65 8329.62 19.21 19.21 -21.23 0.12 96293.26 1894458.51 N 38 35 49.548 W 111 52 9.168
8425.00 0.37 89.07 8424.62 19.31 19.31 -20.60 0.12 96293.36 1894459.15 N 38 35 49.549 W 111 52 9.160
8520.00 0.26 97.30 8519.62 19.29 19.29 -20.08 0.12 96293.34 1894459.67 N 38 35 49.548 W 111 52 9.153
8616.00 0.15 95.50 8615.62 19.25 19.25 -19.74 0.11 96293.30 1894460.01 N 38 35 49.548 W 111 52 9.149

8711.00 0.24 77.69 8710.62 19.28 19.28 -19.42 0.11 96293.33 1894460.33 N 38 35 49.548 W 111 52 9.145
8805.00 0.19 98.69 8804.62 19.30 19.30 -19.07 0.10 96293.35 1894460.67 N 38 35 49.548 W 111 52 9.140
8901.00 0.20 82.62 8900.62 19.30 19.30 -18.75 0.06 96293.34 1894461.00 N 38 35 49.548 W 111 52 9.136
8995.00 0.20 72.06 8994.62 19.37 19.37 -18.43 0.04 96293.42 1894461.31 N 38 35 49.549 W 111 52 9.132
9090.00 1,17 37.09 9089.61 20.19 20.19 -17.69 1.07 96294.24 1894462.06 N 38 35 49.557 W 111 52 9.123

9156.00 2.15 44.93 9155.58 21.61 21.61 -16.41 1.52 96295.65 1894463.34 N 38 35 49.571 W 111 52 9.107
9183.00 2.16 48.06 9182.56 22.31 22.31 -15.67 0.44 96296,35 1894464,07 N 38 35 49.578 W 111 52 9.098
9277.00 1.63 71.99 9276.51 23.90 23.90 -13.08 1.00 96297.95 1894466.66 N 38 35 49.594 W 111 52 9.065
9372.00 0.81 86.36 9371.49 24.36 24.36 -11.13 0.91 96298.41 1894468.62 N 38 35 49.599 W 111 52 9.041
9467.00 0.11 119.44 9466.48 24.36 24.36 -10.38 0.76 96298.41 1894469.37 N 38 35 49.599 W 111 52 9.031

9562.00 0.57 77.49 9561.48 24.42 24.42 -9.84 0.52 96298.47 1894469.91 N 38 35 49.599 W 111 52 9.024
9658.00 1.25 73.01 9657.47 24.83 24.83 -8.37 0.71 96298.88 1894471.38 N 38 35 49.604 W 111 52 9.006
9753.00 0.57 90.24 9752.46 25.13 25.13 -6.90 0.76 96299.18 1894472.84 N 38 35 49.607 W 111 52 8.987
9848.00 0.29 97.59 9847.45 25.10 25.10 -6.19 0.30 96299.14 1894473.55 N 38 35 49.606 W 111 52 8.978
9944.00 1.05 76.81 9943.45 25.26 25.26 -5.10 0.82 96299.31 1894474.65 N 38 35 49.608 W 111 52 8.965

10040.00 0.72 81.70 10039.44 25.55 25.55 -3.64 0.35 96299.60 1894476.10 N 38 35 49.611 W 111 52 8.946
10135.00 0.37 97.28 10134.43 25.60 25.60 -2.75 0.40 96299.65 1894477.00 N 38 35 49.611 W 111 52 8.935
10184.00 0.20 106.73 10183.43 25.56 25.56 -2.51 0.36 96299.60 1894477.24 N 38 35 49.611 W 111 52 8.932

9 5/8" Casinq Point 10242.00 0.14 73.14 10241.43 25 55 2555 -2.34 0.19 96299.59 1894477 40 N 38 35 49.611 W 111 52 8.930
10330.00 0.20 16.06 10329.43 25.73 25.73 -2.20 0.19 96299.77 1894477.55 N 38 35 49.613 W 111 52 8.928

10426.00 0.24 1.02 10425.43 26.09 26.09 -2.15 0.07 96300.14 1894477.60 N 38 35 49.616 W 111 52 8.928
10520.00 0.29 23.49 10519.43 26.50 26.50 -2.05 0.12 96300.55 1894477.70 N 38 35 49.620 W 111 52 8.926
10616.00 0.14 8.99 10615.43 26.84 26.84 -1.93 0.16 96300.89 1894477.81 N 38 35 49.624 W 111 52 8.925
10715.00 0.57 43.24 10714.43 27.32 27.32 -1.58 0.47 96301.37 1894478.17 N 38 35 49.628 W 111 52 8.920
10810.00 0.30 9.05 10809.42 27.91 27.91 -1.21 0.38 96301.96 1894478.53 N 38 35 49.634 W 111 52 8.916

10906.00 1.84 9.98 10905.40 29.68 29.68 -0.91 1.60 96303.72 1894478.84 N 38 35 49.652 W 111 52 8.912
11000.00 2.14 356.82 10999.35 32.92 32.92 -0.74 0.58 96306.96 1894479,00 N 38 35 49.684 W 111 52 8.910
11096.00 2.60 340.82 11095.27 36.76 36.76 -1.56 0.83 96310.81 1894478.19 N 38 35 49.722 W 111 52 8.921
11192.00 2.51 313.53 11191.17 40.27 40.27 -3.80 1.26 96314.32 1894475.95 N 38 35 49.756 W 111 52 8.949

Last SLB MWD SuNey 11288.00 0.00 12.36 11287.14 41.71 41.71 -5.32 2.61 96315.76 1894474.43 N 38 35 49.771 W 111 52 8.968

Projection to Bit 11452.00 0.00 12.36 11451.14 41.71 41.71 -5.32 0.00 96315.76 1894474.43 N 38 35 49.771 W 111 52 8.968

Survev Type: Definitive Survey

Survey Error Model: SLB ISCWSA version 24 *** 3-D 95.00% Confidence 2.7955 sigma
Surveyinq Prog:

MD From (ft) MD To (ft) EOU Freq Survey Tool Type Borehole -> Survey
0.00 34.60 Act-Stns SLB_NSG+MSHOT-Depth Only Original Hole -> Plateau Valley 35-1 Final Surveys (Gyro+MWD) 0' to 11452'

34.60 990.00 Act-Stns SLB_NSG+MSHOT Original Hole -> Plateau Valley 35-1 Final Surveys (Gyro+MWD) 0' to 11452'
990.00 11288.00 Act-Stns SLB_MWD-STD Original Hole -> Plateau Valley 35-1 Final Surveys (Gyro+MWD) 0' to 11452'

11288.00 11452.00 Act-Stns SLB_BLIND+TREND Original Hole -> Plateau Valley 35-1 Final Surveys (Gyro+MWD) 0' to 11452'

*ltalicized stations are NOT used in position calculations.
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STATEOF UTAH FORM 5 *

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

DESIGNATIONOF AGENT OR OPERATOR

The undersigned is, on record, the holder of oil and gas lease

LEASE NAME: Plateau Valley Federal 35-1, Entity #17116 _ j£

LEASE NUMBER: Burrville Federal 3-1, Entity # j'? /7 | S'Û - ßÜO

and hereby designates

NAME: Chris Clark, Regulatory Coordinator 970-263-3628

ADDRESS: OXY USA Inc. 760 Horizon Drive, Suite 101

ciW Grand Junction state CO zip 81506

as his (check one) agent Ol operator 2, with full authority to act in his behalf in complying with the terms of the lease and
regulations applicable thereto and on whom the Division Director or Authorized Agent may serve written or oral instructions in
securing compliance with the Oiland Gas Conservation General Rules and Procedural Rules of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining
of the State of Utah with respect to:

(Describe acreage to which this designation is applicable. Identify each oil and gas well by API number and name. Attach additional pages as
needed.)

It is understood that this designation of agentloperator does not relieve the lessee of responsibility for compliance with the terms
of the lease and the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules and Procedural Rules of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining of the
State of Utah. It is also understood that this designation of agent or operator does not constitute an assignment ofany interest in
the lease.

In case of default on the part of the designated agent/operator, the lessee willmake fulland prompt compliance with all rules, lease
terms or orders of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining of the State of Utah or its authorized representative.

The lessee agrees to promptly notify the Division Director or Authorized Agent of any change in this designation.

Effective Date of Designation: 12/14/2009

BY: (Name) Daniel Padilla OF: (company)OXY USA Inc.

(Signature) (Address) 760 Horizon Drive, Suite 101

(Title) RegulatoryAdvisor city GrandJunction

(Phone) (970) 263-3637 RECEIVED
state CO zip 81506

(5/2000)
DEC22 2009

DIV.0F014GAS&



For Operator N 0415, OXY USA Inc., please note the following changes:

--The operator status on your website indicates "inactive"; the status should be "active"

--Please remove Donna Havins from the contact list; she is no longer working in the
Regulatory Department. Please add the name of Brent Sonnier, Senior Requlatory
Advisor, 5 Greenway Plaza, Suite 110, Houston TX 77046, 713-366-5654.

--Please also remove the name of Blair Rollins; he is no longer employed by Oxy.

--Please add the name of Chris Clark, Regulatory Coordinator, 970-263-3628

--Please add the name of Joan Proulx, Regulatory Administrative Assistant, 970-263-
3641

--Please change the address of the Grand Junction officeto 760 Horizon Drive, #101,
Grand Junction, CO 81506. The address on Compass Drive is no longer valid.

--The correct address for our Houston office is PO Box 27757, Houston, TX 77227-7757

The above changes are in reference to Entity #17116, Plateau Valley Federal 35-1, and
Entity #17171, Burrville Federal 3-1.

RECEIVED
DEC22 2009

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&
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