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WOLVERINE OPERATING COMPANY
of Utah, LLC

Energy Exploration in Partnership with the Environment

February 19, 2007

Ms. Diana Whitney

Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
1594 W. N. Temple, suite 1210

Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

RE:  Application for Permit to Drill
Wolverine Federal 17-8
Covenant Field, Sevier County, UT

Dear Ms. Whitney:

Wolverine Gas & Oil of Utah, LLC is proposing to drill the Wolverine Federal 17-8, which will be
located on BLM surface and minerals. The APD has been submitted to the BLM for approval. A copy
of the APD is included with this letter along with an original Form 3, Application for Permit to Drill.

The Wolverine Federal 17-8 is proposed as a 14,500° Kaibab exploratory test, with a Navajo
completion should the Kaibab prove unproductive. The surface location is 2007’ FSL and 1610’ FWL
of Section 17, T23S-R01W. This well will be drilled as a vertical well, although some “bit walk” up
structure is anticipated. As a vertical well, the proposed bottom hole location would fall
approximately 170° west of the “400” window” allowed under Rule 649-3.2. The exception location is
needed because we would prefer to drill this deeper 14,500° Kaibab test as a vertical well, and re-
locating the surface location further east is not possible, because of the presence of a county road and a
deep ravine associated with Peterson Creek. Utah State Highway 24 is located east of the ravine.

The proposed bottom hole location falls within the Wolverine Federal Unit and Wolverine Gas & Oil
owns the mineral lease for the proposed bottom hole location and the mineral leases within a 460’
radius of the proposed drilling location and for all offset drilling locations (see attached map).

Water for drilling this well will be secured, as was the case for previous drilling in the field, from
Kings Meadow Ranches, LLC, water right #63-2529.

If you have any questions, please contact me.

Sincerely,

%“9 v i RECEIVED

Edward A. Higuera
FEB 2 6 2007

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

Enclosure

One Riverfront Plaza <+ 55 Campau, NW. <+ Grand Rapids, MI 49503-2616 + 616.458.1150
FAX 616.458.0869



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 3

AMENDED REPORT [_]
(highlight changes)

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

5. MINERAL LEASE NO: 6. SURFACE:
UTU 73528 Federal

1A. TYPE OF WORK:

DRILL /]
oL ¥ eas[]

REENTER [  DEEPEN []

B. TYPE OF WELL: OTHER

SINGLE ZONE [_] MULTIPLE ZONE [/]

7. IFINDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

8. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Wolverine Federal Unit

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
Wolverine Gas and Qil Company of Utah, LLC

9. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Wolverine Federal 17-8

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER:

55 Campau NW oy Grand Rapids .. Ml . 49503-2616 | (616) 458-1150

10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

Covenant Field CM 9/

4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) 4/?740)( (/Zq (/g el \/ 3?. 900 LFf2

11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP; RANGE,

MERIDIAN:
atsurrace: 2007 FSL 1610 FWL NESW 17 23S 01W
AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONE:  2007" FSL, 1610' FWL -1l l ' ?7 57 q 2
14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:
3.2 miles south of Sigurd Sevier UTAR
15. DISTANCE TO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE (FEET) 16. NUMBER OF ACRES IN LEASE: 17. NUMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:
678' 8235.79 40
18. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING, COMPLETED, OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:
APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET)
1200' east of WF 17-3 14,500 | BLM WY3329
21. ELEVATIONS (SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22, APPROXIMATE DATE WORK WILL START: 23. ESTIMATED DURATION:
5792' (est. graded elev.) 6/1/2007 90 days
24, PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY, YIELD, AND SLURRY WEIGHT
17.50" 13.375" J-55 68 ppf 1,800 Lead: CBM Lite 350 sx 412 10.5 ppg
Tail: Premium Plus 450 sx 1.19 15.6 ppg
12.25" 9.625" HCP-110 47ppf 10,500 | Stg 1: 50/50 Poz 700 sx 1.71 13 ppg
Stg 2: 50/50 Poz 800 sx 1.21 14.35 ppg
8.5" 4.5" P-110 13.5 ppf 14,500 | 50/50 Poz 1100 sx 1.47  14.35ppg
w/20% silica
25. ATTACHMENTS

VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL. AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES:

WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER IZI COMPLETE DRILLING PLAN

m EVIDENCE OF DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER

Oﬂ.GalmMmIng

D FORM 5, iF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANY OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

name pLease prir) EDWard A. Higuera  / nre _Manager

XL

AW,

iw;n

SIGNATURE oate 2/19/2007

»« — R g il

(This space for State use only)

API NUMBER ASSIGNED: L} 5 -‘0 [ll ’\3 00 44

proval of this
cassarv

fodoral AD
Action is Ne

FEB 2 6 2007

(11/2001) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

wvRECEIVED

CONFIDENTIAL

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
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REESTABLISHED FROM 1967 ) SURVEY

BASIS OF BEARINGS

BASIS OF BEARING USED WAS NO2'12'50"W BETWEEN THE SOUTHWEST CORNER
AND THE WEST QUARTER CORNER OF SECTION 17 T.23 S, R1 W, SLB & M.
LATITUDE: 38°48'02.5483" (38.800707861) NAD 83
LONGITUDE: —111°56'09.6417™ (-111.936011583) NAD 83

EROJECT

Yolvering Ggs & Ol Company of Utagh, LLC.

WELL LOCATION, LOCATED AS SHOWN M THE N.E. 1/4 OF THE
SW. 1/4 OF SECTION 17, T.23 S, R W, SLB. & M.
SEVIER COUNTY, UTAH

\J

LEGEND
»]« = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED
»< = QUARTER SECTION CORNERS LOCATED
= PROPOSED WELL HEAD

NOTE: THE PURPOSE OF THIS SURVEY WAS TO PLAT
THE WOLVERINE FEDERAL #17-8
LOCATION, LQCATED IN THE N.E. 1/4 OF
THE S.W. 1/4 OF SECTION 17, T.23 S, R.1 W,
S.L.B. & M., SEVIER COUNTY, UTAH.

BASIS OF ELEVATION

ELEVATION BASED ON U.5.G.5. BENCH MARK T-30 LOCATED IN
THE SW 1/4 OF SECTION 17, 1.23 S., R1 W, SL8. & M.
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Jones & DeMille En?inurlng
1635 South 100 West ~ Richflald, Utah 84701
Phona (435) 89A-8268
Fax (435) 636~B268
www. jonesanddemile.com

Well Locatlon Plat for

Wolverine Gas & Ol Company of Utgh, L.L.C.
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WOLVERINE GAS AND OIL COMPANY OF UTAH, LLC
DRILLING PLAN

Wolverine Federal 17-8
NE/4 SW/4 Section 17, Township 23 South, Range 1 West, S.L.B.&M.
Sevier County, Utah

Plan Summary:

It is planmed to drill this confidential exploratory well as a vertical bore hole. The well will be drilled to a depth
of 14,500° to test the Navajo, Kaibab, and Toroweap sands. Well path deviation caused by subsurface geologic
irregularities is expected to be the primary drilling concern in this area. No abnormal pressure is anticipated.

The planned location is as follows:
Surface & Bottom-Hole Location: 2007’ FSL, 1610’ FWL, Section 17, T23S, R1W, S.L.B. & M.

Conductor casing will be set at approximately 80 feet and cemented to surface. A 17-1/2” hole will be drilled to
1800° where 13-3/8” surface casing will be set and cemented to surface. A 12-1/4” hole will be drilled through
the Navajo to 10,600° where the well will be logged and 9-5/8” casing will be set and cemented. Then, an 8-
1/2” hole will be drilled through the Kaibab and TD in the Toroweap at 14,500°. If significant porosity and
hydrocarbon shows are encountered in the Kaibab or Toroweap, 4-1/2” casing will be set and cemented at TD.

Drilling activities at this well are expected to commence as early as June 2007 if regulatory approvals are
attained.



Wolverine Gas and Oil Company ofg, LLC
Drilling Program

" Wolverine Federal 17-8

Well Name: Wolverine Federal 17-8
Surface Location: 2007’ FSL, 1610’ FWL
NE/4 SW/4 Section 17, T23S, RO1W, S.I.B. & M.
Sevier County, Utah
TD Bottom-Hole Location: Same as Surface
Elevations: 5792 ( Est. Graded Elevation)
L Geology:
Tops of important geologic markers and anticipated water, oil, gas, and mineral content are as follows:
Pressure
Formation TVD Interval (KB) | MD Interval Contents Gradient
Arapien 0’ - 5746 0’ — 5746
Twin Creek 5746’ — 5848’ 5746° — 5848’ O/G/W 0.44 psi/ft
Navajo 5848’ - 7087 5848’ — 7087’ O/G/W 0.44 psi/ft
Kayenta 7087 —-7201° 7087 —7201°
Wingate 7201 - 7811° 7201 —-7811°
Twin Creek 2 7811 - 8120° 7811 - 8120’ O/G/W 0.44 psi/ft
Navajo 2 8120 - 9520° 8120 —-9520° O/G/W 0.44 psi/ft
Kayenta 2 9520 - 9634’ 9520 —9634°
Wingate 2 9634’ - 9988’ 9634’ — 9988°
Chinle 9988 — 10557’ 9988 — 10557°
Moenkopi 10557 - 13371° 10557 - 13371°
Kaibab 13371°- 14052’ 13371°- 14052’ O/G/W 0.44 psi/ft
Toroweap’ 14052 — 14424° 14052 - 14424° O/G/W 0.44 psi/ft
Total Depth 14,500° 14,500°
IL. Well Control:

The contracted drilling rig has a 10M BOP system but conditions only require a 5SM BOP system. BOPE
will be in place and tested as a SM system prior to drilling out the surface casing shoe. See attached
schematic of BOPE.

A. The BOPE will as a minimum include the following:

Wellhead Equipment (5M Min.):
BOPE Item

Annular Preventer

Double Rams (5” Pipe - top, Blind - bottom)

Drilling Spool w/ 2 side outlets (4” Choke Line, 4” Kill Line)

Flange Size and Ratin
13-5/8” 5M
13-5/8” 10M
13-5/8” 10M x 13-5/8” 10M

Single Ram (Blind) 13-5/8” 10M
Spacer Spool 13-5/8” 10M x 13-5/8” 10M
Casing Spool (Multi-Bowl) 13-5/8” 10M x 13-5/8” 5M

Casing Head (13-5/8” SOW, w/ two 2-1/16” SSO’s)

Auxiliary Equipment (SM Min.):
BOPE Item
Choke Line with 2 valves (3” minimuym)
Kill Line with 2 valves and one check valve (2 Minimum)

13-5/8” 5M




Wolverine Gas and Oil Company ot., LLC '

Drilling Program
Wolverine Federal 17-8

2 Chokes with one remotely controlled at a location readily accessible to the driller
Upper and lower kelly cock valves with handles

Safety Valves to fit all drill string connections in use

Inside BOP or float sub

Pressure gauge on choke manifold

Fill-up line above the uppermost preventer

Wear bushing in casing head

B. Choke manifold will be functionally equipped and sized at a minimum as shown on the attached
diagram. All chokes will be straight lines, or use tee blocks or be targeted with rumnning tees if there
are turns, and all choke lines will be anchored. All valves (except chokes) in the kill line choke
manifold and choke line will be full opening and allow straight through flow.

C. System accumulator will have sufficient capacity to open the hydraulically-controlled gate valve and
close all rams plus the annular preventer (3 ram system will have added 50 percent safety factor to
compensate for any fluid loss in the control system or preventers) and retain a minimum pressure of
200 psi above pre-charge on the closing manifold without use of the closing unit pumps. The fluid
reservoir capacity shall be double the usable fluid volume of the accurmilator system capacity and the
fluid level of the reservoir shall be maintained at the manufacturer's recommendations. The
accumulator will have two (2) independent power sources available to close the preventers. Nitrogen
bottles may be one of those sources, and if so, will have charge maintained per manufacturer's
specifications.

D. Accumulator pre-charge pressure test will be conducted prior-to connecting the closing unit to the
BOP stack and at least once every 6 months. The accumulator pressure will be corrected if the
measured precharge pressure is found to be above or below the maximum or minimum specified limits,
Only nitrogen gas will be used to precharge.

E. Power for the closing unit pumps will be available to the unit at all times so that the pumps will
automatically start when the closing valve manifold pressure has decreased to the pre-set level.

F.  Accumulator pump capacity will be such that, with the accumulator system isolated from service, the
pumps will be capable of opening the hydraulically-operated gate valve (if so equipped), plus closing
the annular preventer on the smallest size drill pipe to be used within 2 minutes, and retaining a
minimum of 200 psi above the specified accunmlator pre-charge pressure.

G. Locking devices, either manual (i.e., hand wheels) or automatic, will be installed on the ram type
preventers. A valve will be installed in the closing line as close as possible to the annular preventer to
act as a locking device. This valve shall be maintained in the open position and shall be closed only
when the power source for the accurmulator system is inoperative.

H. Remote controls will be readily accessible to the driller and will be capable of both opening and
closing all preventers. Master controls shall be at the accummlator and shall be capable of opening and
closing all preventers and the choke line valve.

L. Well control equipment testing will be performed using clear water when the equipment is initially
installed, whenever any seal subject to test pressure is broken, following related repairs, and as a
minimum, every 30-day interval. The tests will apply to all related well control equipment.

Ram type preventers and associated equipment will be isolated and tested to 5000 psi. The annular
preventer will be tested to 2500 psi. Pressure shall be maintained for at least 10 minutes or until
requirements of test are met, whichever is longer, for all tests. A casing head valve will be open below
the test plug during testing of the BOP stack. Valves will be tested from the working pressure side with
all down-stream valves open. Kill line valves will be tested with the check valve held open or the ball
removed.

Pipe and blind rams will be activated each trip, but not more than once a day. The annular preventers
will be functionally operated at least weekly. A pit level drill will be conducted weekly for each crew.
All BOPE drills and tests will be recorded in the IADC driller’s log.



Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of.a LLC
Drilling Program
Wolverine Federal 17-8

1. Casing and Cementing:

A. Casing Program (all new casing):

Coupling Setting
Hole Size Casing Size | Weight Grade Connection | Diameter Depth
30~ 24> Conductor 80’ GL
17.50” 13.375” 68.0 J-55 BTC 14.375” 1800’ KB
12.25” 9.625” 47.0 HCP-110 LTC 10.625” 10500° KB
8.50” 4.500” 13.5 P-110 LTC 5.000” 14500° KB
_ Surface Production 1 | Production 2
Casing O. D. (in) 13.375 9.625 4.500
Casing Grade J-55 HCP-110 P-110
Weight of Pipe (Ibs/ft) 68.0 47.0 13.5
Connection BTC LTC LTC
Top Setting Depth - MD (ft) 0 0 0
‘Top Setting Depth - TVD (ft) 0 0 0
Bottom Setting Depth - MD (ft) 1800 10600 14500
Bottom Setting Depth - TVD (ft) 1800 10600 14500
Maximum Mud Weight - Inside (ppg) 10 10.5 10.5
Maximum Mud Weight - Qutside (ppg) 10 10.5 10.5
Design Cement Top - TVD (i) 0 5200 10000
Design Cement Top - MD (ff) 0 5200 10000
Max. Hydrostatic Inside w/ Dry Outside (psi) 936 5788 7917
Casing Burst Rating (psi) 3450 9440 12410
Burst Safety Factor (1.10 Minimum) 3.69 1.63 1.35
Max. Hydrostatic Outside w/ Dry Inside (psi) 936 5788 7917
Collapse Rating 1950 7100 10670
Collapse Safety Factor (1.125 Minimum) 2.08 1.23 1.35
Casing Weight in Air 1000 Ibs 122.4 498.2 195.8
Body Yield 1000 Ibs 1069 1453 422
Joint Strength 1000 Ibs 1140 1213 338
Tension Safety Factor (1.70 Minimum) 9.31 2.43 1.73

Casing with same or greater burst, collapse, and tension rating may be substituted for any of the
planned casing sizes depending on availability and actual conditions.



Wolverine Gas and Oil Company ofg, LLC

Drilling Program
Wolverine Federal 17-8

B. Cementing Program

Casing Size Cement Slurry Quantity (sks) Density (ppg) | Yield !ft3/sk)
13.375” Lead: CBM Lite 350 10.5 4.12
13.375” Tail: Premium Plus 450 15.6 1.19
9.625” Stg 1: 50:50 POZ 700 13.0 1.71

Stg 2: 50:50 POZ 800 14.35 1.21
4.500” Tail: 50:50 POZ, w/20% 1100 14.35 1.47
silica, retarder
Surface: 13-3/8” surface casing will be cemented from setting depth (1800°) to surface and

Production 1:

Production 2:

Other:

topped out with premium cement if necessary. Hardware will include a guide shoe,
float collar, top plug, and a minimum of one centralizer per joint on the bottom
three (3) casing joints. Water or other preflush fluid pumped ahead of the slurry
will separate cement from the drilling fluids.

9-5/8” production casing will be cemented from setting depth (10600°) to 5000°
(at least 500” above the Navajo top). A minimum of 20 percent silica will be added
to the cement shurry if bottom-hole temperature exceeds 230 °F. Sharry volume
will be based on calipered hole size plus 25% excess. Hardware will include a
guide shoe, float collar, top plug, and centralizers on bottom and as needed across
any pay zones. Water and preflush fluid pumped ahead of the shury will separate
cement from the drilling fluids.

4.5” production casing will be cemented in one stage from setting depth (145007)
to 10000° (at least 500° into 9-5/8” casing). A minimum of 20 percent silica will
be added to the cement slurry if bottom-hole temperature exceeds 230 °F. Slurry
volume will be based on calipered hole size plus 25% excess. Hardware will
include a guide shoe, float collar, top plug, and centralizers as needed across any
pay zones. Water and preflush fluid pumped ahead of the shury will separate
cement from the drilling fluids.

- The BLM will be notified at least twenty-four hours prior to running and
cementing the surface and production casing strings.

- Actual cement slurries for all casing will be based on final service company
recommendations.

- The size, weight, grade, type of thread, number of joints, and footage of all
casing run will be recorded in the driller’s log. The amount and type of all cement
pumped will be recorded in the driller’s log.

- Adequate time will be allowed before drilling out for the cement at the casing
shoe to achieve a minimum 500-psi compressive strength.

- All casing strings will be tested to 1500 psi before drilting out and if pressure
declines by more than 10 percent in 30 minutes, corrective action will be taken.

- Before drilling more than 20 feet of new hole below each casing string, a
pressure integrity test of the casing shoe will be performed to a minimum of the
mud weight equivalent anticipated to control the pore pressure to the next casing
depth or at total depth of the well.



Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of ., LLC .

Drilling Program
Wolverine Federal 17-8

Iv. Mud Program:

Mud

Depth Weight (ppg) Mud Type Viscosity Fluid Loss
0 - 1800° 8.4-92 Fresh Water 26 -50 N/Cto 12 cc

1800° — 10600’ 9.2-10.5 Salt Mud 36-50 N/Cto 8 cc

10600’ — 14500° 9.0-10.5 Salt Mud 36-42 8—10cc

After mudding up, slow pump rates will be taken daily and recorded in the driller’s log.

Visual mud monitoring equipment will be in place to detect volume changes indicating loss or gain of
circulating fluid volume.

Abnormal pressures are not anticipated. In the event such pressures are to be anticipated,
electronic/mechanical mud monitoring equipment will be in place and include as a minimum; pit
volume totalizer (PVT); stroke counter; and flow sensor.

A mud test will be performed every 24 hours after mudding up to determine, as applicable: density,
viscosity, gel strength, filtrate, and pH.

The 10M BOPE system is not required for conditions on this well and use of the trip tank is not
anticipated.

Gas detecting equipment will be installed in the mud return system, and hydrocarbon gas shall be
monitored for pore pressure changes. The presence of Hydrogen Sulfide gas is not expected.

The need to vent combustible or noncombustible gas is not expected. If needed, a flare system
designed to gather and burn all gas will be available. The flare line discharge will be located more than
100 feet from the well head and it will be positioned downwind of the prevailing wind direction. The
flare line will have straight lines unless turns are targeted with running tees and it will be anchored.
The flare system will have an effective method for ignition.

Abnormal pressure is not expected. If abnormal pressure is to be anticipated, a mud-gas separator (gas
buster) will be installed and operable beginning at a point at least 500 feet above any anticipated
hydrocarbon zone of interest.

V. Evaluation:

A,

B.

Mud Log: A mud logging unit will be in operation from a depth of approximately 1800 feet to TD.
Samples will be caught, cleaned, bagged, and marked as required. :

Drill Stem Tests: No DST’s are expected.

Coring: No whole coring is planned. Rotary side-wall cores may be taken at select intervals in
conjunction with open-hole logging operations.

Wireline Logs: Wireline logs will be run as hole conditions allow from total depth to surface casing to
assist in determining lithology and potential for hydrocarbon recovery. The logging tools will at a
minimum survey resistivity, gamma radiation, and sonic velocity.

VI. Expected Bottom-Hole Pressure and Abnormal Conditions:

A.

Hydrogen Sulfide: Hydrogen Sulfide (H,S) gas is not expected in the geologic formations to be
penetrated by this well.



Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Q, LLC .

Drilling Program
Wolverine Federal 17-8

B. Pressure: No abnormally pressured zones are expected in this well. The pressure gradient for all
potentially productive formations is expected to be approximately 0.44 psi/ft.

C. Temperature: No abnormally high temperatures are expected. Bottom-hole temperature is expected to
be approximately 290 °F.



WOLVERINE FEDERAL 17-8

13 5/8" 10M Blowout Preventer Stack Arrangement
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Company of Utah, LLC
Contractor: SST Rig # 68

hydril

/r 5k Annular
45 13651Ibs.
N4
/
Fipe
66.5
Blinds

Blinds pipe rams
LI '-I < Operator's 13-5/8" 10m MBS
ltem Manufacturer Type Serial# Height (in)  Weight (Ibs)
Annular shaffer bolted cover 45.0 13,651
Double ram Shaffer SL 6.5 25,365
Mud cross 4" 10M 24.0 2,650
Single ram Shaffer SL 48.5 15,295

Ground to rotory beam clearance -19.5

| total]l 1840 | 56,961

|

n>t (53]

Imamy mAn A s~

NI INAND



SURFACE USE PLAN
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
Attachment for Permit to Drill
Name of Operator: ‘Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah,
Address: 55 Campau NW
Grand Rapids, Michigan, 49503-2616
Well Location: Wolverine Federal 17-8

2,007° FSL & 1,610° FWL, NE/4 SW/4,
Section 17, T238, R1W, SLB&M
Sevier County, Utah

State and Fee surface use are not required for construction and drilling of the referenced well, Federal
surface nse is being requested with this application through the BLM — Richfield Field Office.

The dirt contractor will be provided with an approved copy of the surface use plan of operations before
initiating construction.

A Federal onsite inspection was conducted on Thursday, September 7, 2006 with the following individuals present:
- Charlie Irons — Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC
Edward A. Higuera - Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC.
Darin Robinson - Jones & DeMille Engineering
Jean Sinclear - Buys & Associates
Rod Lee - BLM
Michael Jackson - BLM Geologist
Glen Nebeker - BLM Geologist and Team Leader
Wayne Wetzel - BLM Associate Field Manager
Tim Finger — BLM Outdoor Recreation Planner
Larry Greenwood - BLM Biologist
Mark Rickenbach - Road Supervisor, Sevier County Road Commission

1. Existing Roads:
a. The proposed well site is located approximately 3.20 miles southeast of Sigurd, Utah and 3.7
miles east of Venice, Utah. :

b. From Sigurd, Utah travel southeast along SR-24 under Utah Department of Transportation
(UDOT) maintenance approximately 3.75 miles to an existing bladed road surface under
Sevier County Road Department maintenance on the west side of the road. Travel along the
existing county road in a northwesterly direction approximately 300’ to the proposed wellsite.

c. Directions to the proposed well site can be seen on the location map of Exhibit C.
d. The proposed access road will encroach SR-24 under UDOT maintenance. An encroachment

application will be submitted to UDOT and approved prior to upgrade and use of the existing
encroachment. No upgrades to the State Road system are proposed at this time.



Proposed access will require upgrade of the existing Sevier County Road Department
maintained bladed surface. An encroachment permit will also be secured from Sevier County
prior to an upgrade of the existing surface.

All existing roads will be maintained and kept in good repair during all phases of operation.

Vehicle operators will obey posted speed restrictions and observe safe speeds commensurate
with road and weather conditions.

Improvements are planned to the existing access road from the UDOT maintained SR-24
highway surface to the proposed wellsite along the existing county road.

An off-lease Federal right-of-way is not anticipated for the access corridor because the
corridor is located within the existing lease boundary.

2. Planned Access Roads:

a.

From the Sevier County Road Department maintained bladed surface an access road and an
egress road are proposed to the proposed well site. The access consists of entirely new
construction for the access and egress road, neither of which crosses any significant drainage.
A road alignment plan has been included within this package for the upgraded access and
new access road lengths.

The access road will be constructed with the minimum surface disturbance necessary to
facilitate safe and effective travel during drilling operations. The road will then be further
upgraded to the included plan as necessary for longer term year-round access during
continued production operations.

The proposed new access and egress roads will consist of a 12° travel surface with no truck
rnouts. The ROW for the proposed road will accommodate cuts and fills where needed, as
such, the total ROW width will vary as shown within Exhibit “B” with 2 5° buffer area on
each side of the proposed disturbance for the road segments.

State or fee surface use approval is not necessary for the road construction.

A maximum grade of 10% is anticipated along the road length, An acceptable grade will be
maintained throughout the project with no major cuts and fills required to access the well.

The existing culvert along the county road leaving the UDOT surface will be replaced with
an 18” culvert that is 56° or greater in length. Drainage structures have been incorporated
into the road design package that has been attached to this application. Energy dissipating
structures and silt fences will be utilized to minimize erosion that may result from the
drainage structures.

No surfacing material will come from Federal lands.

No gates or cattle guards are anticipated at this time.

Surface disturbance and vehicular travel will be limited to the approved location access road.

The operator will be responsible for all maintenance of the access road including drainage
structures during drilling and/or operation of the well.



Location of Existing Wells:

a.

Following is a list of existing wells within a one mile radius of the proposed well:

1. Water wells One (culinary supply well for Covenant Field,
Section 20 T23S-R1W, Sevier County, UT)
ii. Imjection wells None
iii. Disposal wells None
iv. Drilling wells None
v. Temp. shut-in wells None
vi. Producing wells 10 producing wells in the Covenant Field
vii. Abandon wells One (Wolverine Federal #8-1)

Location of Production Facilities:

AN permanent structures will be painted to match the Covenant Facilities, which is painted
non-reflective Carlsbad Cavern Tan, unless otherwise directed by the AO. All facilities will
be painted within six months of installation. Facilities requiring compliance with the
Occupational Safety and Health Act (OSHA) may be excluded.

A temporary testing facility may be constructed on this location and if so, it will be
surrounded by a dike of sufficient capacity to contain the storage capacity of the largest tank.
All loading lines and valves will be placed inside the berm surrounding the tank battery
location.

Any necessary pits will be properly fenced to prevent any wildlife and livestock entry.

All access roads will be upgraded and maintained as necessary to prevent erosion and
accommmodate year-round traffic. The road will be maintained in a safe useable condition.

The site will require periodic maintenance to ensure that drainages are kept open and free of
debris, ice, and snow, and that surfaces are properly treated to reduce erosion, fugitive dust,

and impacts to adjacent areas.

A pipeline and possible treater / load-out area will be addressed in a forthcoming EA.

Loéation and Type of Water Supply:

a.

Wolverine intends to purchase water from Kings Meadow Ranch, which was the supply for
the other Covenant wells.

Water will be trucked to the well site from the hydrant located at the Covenant CPF utilizing
approved access roads, or a temporary above-ground pipe would be laid from the Kings
Meadow Ranch property to the proposed well paid.

No water well is proposed with this application.
Should additional water sources be pursued they will be properly permitted through the State

of Utah — Division of Water Rights. Additionally, the BLM and UDOGM will be notified of
any changes in water supply.



Source of Construction Material:

a,

b.

No construction matierials will be removed from Federal lands.

If any gravel is used, it will be obtained from a state approved gravel pit.

Methods of Handling Waste Disposal:

a.

All wastes associated with this application will be contained and disposed of utilizing
approved facilities.

Drill cuttings will be contained and buried on site.
The reserve pit will be located inboard of the location and near the southwest edge of the pad.
The reserve pit will be constructed so as not to leak, break, or allow any discharge.

The reserve pit will be lined with 12 mil minimum thickness plastic nylon reinforced liner
material. The liner will overlay a felt liner pad only if rock is encountered during excavation.
The pit liner will overlap the pit walls and be covered with dirt and/or rocks to hold it in
place. No trash, scrap pipe, etc. that could puncture the liner will be disposed of in the pit.
Pit walls will be sloped no greater than 2:1. A minimum 2-foot freeboard will be maintained
in the pit at all times during the drilling and completion operation.

The reserve pit has been located in cut material. Three sides of the reserve pit will be fenced
before drilling starts. The fourth side will be fenced as soon as drilling is completed, and
shall remain until the pit is dry. After the reserve pit has dried, all areas not needed for
production will be rehabilitated.

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA Title III (hazardous materials) in an amount
greater than 10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of
annually in association with the drilling, testing, or completion of the well. Furthermore, no
extremely hazardous substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities,
will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling,
testing, or completion of the well.

Trash will be contained in a trash cage and hauled away to an approved disposal site as
necessary but no later than at the completion of drilling operations. The contents of the trash
container will be hauled off periodically to the approved Sevier County Landfill near Sigurd,
Utah.

Produced fluids from the well other than water will be produced into a test tank until such
time as construction of production facilities is completed. Any spills of oil, gas, salt water or
other produced fluids will be cleaned up and removed.

Any salts and/or chemicals, which are an integral part of the drilling system, will be disposed
of in the same manner as the drilling fluid.

Sanitary facilities will be on site at all times during operations. Sewage will be placed in a
portable chemical toilet and the toilet replaced periodically utilizing a licensed contractor to
transport the portable chemical toilet by truck so that its contents can be delivered to the



-

10.

Salina Wastewater Treatment Facility in accordance with state and county regulations.

Ancillary Facilities:

a.

Garbage Containers and Portable Toilets are the only ancillary facilities proposed in this
application.

Well Site Lavout: (See Exhibit B)

a.

b.

The well will be properly identified in accordance with BLM and state regulations.
Access to the well pad will be from the southeast.

The pad and road designs are consistent with BLM specifications.

A pre-construction meeting with responsible company representative, contractors and the
BLM will be conducted at the project site prior to commencement of surface-disturbing
activities. The pad and road will be construction-staked prior to this meeting.

All surface disturbing activities will be supervised by a qualified, responsible company
representative who is aware of the terms and conditions of the APD and specifications in the
approved plans.

All cut and fill slopes will be such that stability can be maintained for the life of the activity.

Diversion ditches will be constructed as shown around the well site to prevent surface waters
form entering the well site area. :

The site surface will be graded to drain away from the pit to avoid pit spillage during large
storm events.

The stockpiled topsoil (first 6 inches or maximum available) will be stored in a windrow on
the uphill side of the location to prevent any possible contamination. All topsoil will be
stockpiled for reclamation in such a way as to prevent soil loss and contamination.

Pits will remain fenced until site cleanup.

Water spraying may be implemented if necessary to minimize the amount of fugitive dust.

Plans for Restoration of the Surface:

Site reclamation for a producing well will be accomplished for portions of the site not
required for the continued operation of the well.

The Operator will control noxious weeds along access road use authorizations, well sites, or
other applicable facilities by spraying ormechanical removal, A list of noxious weeds may
be obtained from the BLM or the appropriate County Extension Office.

Upon well completion, any hydrocarbons in the pit shall be removed in accordance with
BLM and state regulations. Once the reserve pit is dry, the plastic nylon reinforced liner
shall be torn and perforated before backfilling of the reserve pit. The reserve pit and that
portion of the location not needed for production facilities/operations will be recontoured to



the approximate natural contours.

The cut and fill slopes and all other disturbed areas not needed for the production operation
will be top soiled and re-vegetated. The stockpiled topsoil will be evenly distributed over the
disturbed area.

Prior to reseeding the site, all disturbed areas, including the access road, will be scarified and
left with a rough surface. The site will then be seeded and/or planted as prescribed by the
BILM.

11. Surface and Mineral Ownership;

Surface Ownership -- United States of America under the management of the BLM ~ Richfield

a.
 Field Office, 150 East 900 North, Richfield, Utah 84701; 435-896-1500.
b. Mineral Ownership —~ United States of America under the management of the BLM — Richfield
Field Office, 150 East 900 North, Richfield, Utah 84701; 435-896-1500.
12. Other Information:
a. Western Land Services has conducted a Class ITI archeolo gical survey. A copy of the report has
. been submitted under separate cover to the appropriate agencies by Western Land Services.

b. Buys & Associates, Inc. will conduct a T&E survey and prepare an EA for the proposed well site.
A copy of the T&E report and EA will be submitted under separate cover to the appropriate
agencies by Buys & Associates, Inc.

¢. Additional information:

a. No drainage crossings that require additional State or Federal approval are being
crossed.

b. No raptor nests are known to exist within one mile of the proposed wellsite.

c. A paleontological clearance is not required since suitable fossil-bearing surface
formations do not exist within the project area.



13. Operator’s Representative and Certification
Title Name Office Phone
Company Representative (Richfield) Charlie Irons 1-435-896-1943
Company Representative (Grand Rapids) Edward Hignera 1-616-458-1150
Agent for Wolverine Don Hamilton 1-435-719-2018
Certification:

I hereby certify that I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the proposed
drill site and access route; that [ am familiar with the conditions which currently exist; that
the statements made in this APD package are, to the best of my knowledge, true and correct;
and that the work associated with the operations proposed herein will be performed by
Wolverine Operating Company of Utah, LLC and its contractors and subcontractors in
conformity with this APD package and the terms and conditions under which it is approved. I
also certify responsibility for the operations conducted on that portion of the leased lands
associated with this application, with bond coverage being provided under Wolverine’s
pending existing BLM Bond. This statement is subject to the provisions of 18 U.S.C. 1001
for the filing of a false statement.

Date: /213 —06
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WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 02/26/2007

API NO.

ASSIGNED:

43-041-30047

WELL NAME: WOLVERINE FED 17-8
OPERATOR: WOLVERINE GAS & OIL CO { N1655 ) PHONE NUMBER: 616-458-1150
CONTACT : ED HIGUERA
PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
NESW 17 2308 0Llow Tech Review Initials Date
SURFACE: 2007 FSL 1610 FWL
BOTTOM: 2007 FSL 1610 FWL Engineering
COUNTY : SEVIER Geology
LATITUDE: 38.80068 LONGITUDE: -110.9352
UTM SURF EASTINGS: 418790 NORTHINGS: 4294866 Surface
FIELD NAME: COVENANT ( 492 )
LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal
LEASE NUMBER: UTU 73528 PROPOSED FORMATION: KBAB
SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal COALBED METHANE WELL? NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED:

\/ Plat

LOCATION AND SITING:

WOLVERINE EQL/

_ R649-2-3.
i~ Bond: Fed[1l] Ind[] Stal]l Feel] Unit
{(No. wy3329 )
B Potash (Y/N) _____ R649-3-2.

General

A [ 0il Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting: 460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells
v~ Water Permit W/ R649-3-3. Exception

(No. 63-2529 ) L _

- Drilling Unit

I Z RDCC Review (Y/N) —

(Date: ) Board Cause No:

: Eff Date:

A{A Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

In mingl Y/N . . .
L tent to Com gle (Y/N) R649-3-11. Directional Drill
COMMENTS :

STIPULATIONS : [ - %o s
z" Qe
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Field Status UnitESxtla)t'tlé T < PLUGGED & ABANDONED
ABANDONED +¢ PRODUCING GAS
E ACTIVE GAS STORAGE ® PRODUCING OIL
NE PP OIL ++ SHUT-IN GAS
COMBINED NE SECONDARY g w E
INACTIVE 3
S CJ PIOIL X e aEalp oD
STORAGE AL L) .
== TERMINATED PP GEOTHERML A WATER INJECTION S
[ PPOIL @ WATER SUPPLY PREPARED BY: DIANA MASON
[] SECONDARY 4¢ WATER DISPOSAL DATE: 28-FEBRUARY-2007
[ JTERMINATED .. DRILLING




State of Utah

Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAEL R. STYLER
Executive Director
Division of
Oil, Gas & Mining

JOHN R. BAZA
Division Director

}. I

JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
Governor

GARY R. HERBERT

Lieutenant Governor

March 1, 2007

Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC
55 Campau NW
Grand Rapids, MI 49503-2616

Re: Wolverine Federal 17-8 Well, 2007' FSL, 1610' FWL, NE SW, Sec. 17,
T. 23 South, R. 1 West, Sevier County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

Appropriate information has been submitted to DOGM and administrative
approval of the requested exception location is hereby granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-041-30047.

Sincerely,
L.
Gil Hunt
Associate Director
pab
Enclosures
cc: Sevier County Assessor

Bureau of Land Management, Moab District Office

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 ¢ facsimile (801) 359-3940 « TTY (801) 538-7458 « www.ogm.utah.gov



Operator: Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC

Well Name & Number Wolverine Federal 17-8

API Number: 43-041-30047

Lease: UTU-73528

Location: NE SW Sec._17 T. 23 South R. 1 West

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements

W

Notify the division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
e Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
e Contact Dustin Doucet at (801) 538-5281

. Reporting Requirements

All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be

wn

obtained prior to drilling.

. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have

not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the “Board”).
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.



STATE OF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator: Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC Operator Account Number: N / @5 Q
Address: 55 Campau NW, One Riverfront Plaza

city Grand Rapids

state M! zip 49503-2616 Phone Number: (616) 458-1150
Well 1
AP! Number Well Name QQ | Sec | Twp | Rng County
4304130047 Wolverine Federal 17-8 NESW 17 238 1w Sevier
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date
A 99999 1 /ea/7 611612007 ¢/38/07

Comments: . tical Kaibab well CD N Fl D

Well 2
API Number Well Name QQ Sec | Twp | Rng County
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date
Comments:
Well 3
API Number Well Name QQ | Sec | Twp | Rng County
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date
Comments:
ACTION CODES:

A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) Steven R Hash - EXECT Engineering Inc

B - Add new well to existing entity (group or unit well) Na lease, t !‘ Z

€ - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity %w

D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity Signature

E - Other (Explain in ‘comments’ section) Engineering Consultant 6/22/2007

RECE‘VED Title Date
o JUN 2 6 2007

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



e -

For 3160-5 UNITED STATES s
(Apr 2004 DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR P
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

FIETAT
fLE g FORM APPROVED
Looos by OM B No. 1004-0137
3 I 17 « b Expires: March 31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.
UTU 73528

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side.

1. Type of B
WeoRBGiwel  [Jomswel  [JOter

7. 1f Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

Wolverine Federal Unit

2. Name of Op " Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC

8. Well Name and No.
Wolverine Federal 17-8

3a Address
55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI 49503-2616

3b. Phone No. (include area code)
616-458-1150

9. API Well No.
43-041-30047

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R, M., or Survey Description) (_/I 57 ?‘Z X 3? 8007/‘/
2020' FSL, 1602' FWL, Section 17, T23S, R1W, SLB&M
F294370Y 1. 935217

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
Covenant Field

11. County or Parish, State

Sevier, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[ Acidize (] Deepen [ production (StartResume)  L_Water Shut-Off
[ INotice of Intent [] Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity
Subsequent Report D Casing Repair New Construction D Recomplete Other As-built Location
, , [ Change Pians [ Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abendon
[ Final Abandonment Notice CconverttoInjection L] Plug Back [ water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

The location for the subject well was altered to accomodate multiple well drilling on the pad. The actual location for the subject well is 2020
FSL, 1602' FWL, Section 17, T23S, R1W, SLB&M with a final graded ground elevation of 5793'. This well spot is approximately 15 feet from
the originally permitted location of 2007' FSL, 1610' FWL, Section 17, T23S, R1W, SLB&M. There is no significant change to the drilling pad
from the previously approved configuration. A new well location survey plat and diagram of drilling pad layout are included herewith.

Attachements: Well Location Plat, Well Location Layout (2)

Federal Approval of this
Action is Necaessary

RECEIVED
JUL g5 290

DIV.QF ou _GA

Q
1A~

14. Ihereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Ellis M. Peterson

QD

WINING

Title Senoir Production Engineer

Date

Y o

07/03/2007

N\ . . [TF{S\SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE
Approvedly Qe U A L e e ¢ _ _emille Date b:» -—VL-'O
Conditions of approval, if any, ed. Approva] of this notice does not warrant or *
certify that the applicant holds le itable title to those rights in the subject lease * ERNYIRONMENTAL MANAGER

which would entitle the applicant to cohduct operations thereon. -

. Title I8 US.C. Section 1001 and Title43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make ita erime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
“Statésdiy Talse, fictittous or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

. nhnn("q’l Daée 2)



Section 17, T.23 S., R.1 W.,, S.L.B. & M.

NORTHWEST CORNER SECTION 17,
T.23 S, R1 W, SLB. &M
‘/ FOUND 2004 SEV. CO. ALUM. CAP

NORTH QUARTER CORNER SECTION 17,
T23 S, RI W, SLB. & M
/ FOUND 1967 B.L.M. BRASS CAP

> r_ __ N8909'14™W 2595.84' —>-|-<— N8IT7'IS"W 2615.14' . v,
NORTHEAST CORNER SECTION 17, ; |
2 T.23 5, RY W, S.LB. & M.
@ & o | FOUND 1967 B.LM. BRASS CAP
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Q;\Ogoo“ Lo EAST QUARTER CORNER SECTION 17,
Q® o T23S, R1 W, SLB. & M
é}}O FOUND 1967 B.L.M. BRASS CAP
NB915'48E 2525.31" i!r__ N8915'48E 2536.59"
ﬁssrsoumraz cgt;m&sacnm 17, WOLVERINE FEDERAL
FOUND 1967 B.LM. BRASS CAP - g‘LE;AangZAEE%7%§O(%‘D
1602° F.WL. - ’ Q’Q} ’
l‘_ W ° o ! 8
o W ) - o <
Lo \ L -E
z= ® '8 ]
x o | IN w
8o I. = 3
53 £ 5 & B
Vi \8 x ) W .8
A i 3 {\(\ o 0\’ 3
31 Im z a@ %
W | W Wl 2
) ) O W@
| : SOUTHEAST CORNER SECTION 17,
| | 723 S, R1 W SLB, & M.
'| FOUND 1967 B.L.M. BRASS CAP\I
' —_ -
& __L — & \ET3T02°F 2459.25 A
i N87°31'02°€ 2459.25
\ SOUTH QUARTER CORNER SECTION 17,
SOUTHWEST CORNER SECTION 17, 123 S, Ri W, SLB & WM.
T23S., R1 W, SLB. & M. REESTABLISHED FROM 1967 SURVEY
FOUND 1967 B.LM. BRASS CAP BASIS OF BEARINGS

BASIS OF BEARING USED WAS NO02712'50"W BETWEEN THE SOUTHWEST CORNER
AND THE WEST QUARTER CORNER OF SECTION 17 1.23 S, R.1 W, S.LB. & M.
LATTUOE: 38°48°02.5191" 53&800727528) NAO 83

LONGITUDE: —-111"56°09.7808

—111.936050222) NAD 83

PROJECT
Wolverine Gos & Ol Company of Utgh, LLC,

WELL LOCATION, LOCATED AS SHOWN IN THE N.E 1/4 OF THE
S.W. 1/4 OF SECTION 17, T.23 S, R1 W, SLB. & M.
SEVIER COUNTY, UTAH

LEGEND
]« = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED
> = OUARTER SECTION CORNERS LOCATED
® - PROPOSED WELL HEAD

7

NOTE: THE PURPOSE OF THIS SURVEY WAS TO PLAT
THE WOLVERINE FEDERAL #17-8
LOCATION. LOCATED IN THE N.E. 1/4 OF
THE S.W. 1/4 OF SECTION 17, T.23 S, R1 W.,
S.LB. & M., SEVER COUNTY, UTAH,

BASIS OF ELEVATION

ELEVATION BASED DN U.S.G.S. BENCH MARK T-30 LOCATED IN
THE SW 1/4 OF SECTION 17, .23 S.. R.1 W., SLB. & M.

1000’
500"
1000°

k=)

M

SCALE

CERTIFICATE

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THIS PLAT WAS PREPAREO FROM
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MADE B8Y ME OR UNDER
MY SUPERVISION, AND THAT THE SAME ARE TRUE AND
CORRECT TO THE BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE AND BEUEF.

AR glnoorin?

30~/ Richtield, Utah 84701

www jonesanddemille cam

Well Location Plat for

Wolverine Gos & O Compony of Utaeh, LL.C.

SURVEYED CHECKED  JORawN PROVECT NO
- K.D.8. T.R.G. T.R.G.
DATE DWG NANE SCALE 0604009 ]
—befo/w el toc_|Fioon
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SPOIL \ LOCATION LAYOUT FOR

A WOLVERINE FEDERAL §#17-8
b SECTION 17, T.23 S., R1 W., SLB.& M.
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PIT CAPAQITY = 30,000 Buls (2 FI’EEB(MH))‘.;‘- E;
=

TOTAL PAD AREA: 2.71 ACRES =% %

FIT AREA: Q.43 ACRES —_— Z UNCOMPACTED A SEVIER

L . A ~

U e Mk S0 b0 gl e SP01




WOLVERINE GAS AND OIL COMPANY
OF UTAH, LLC

Energy Exploration in Partnership with the Environment

July 3, 2007

Mr. Gil Hunt

Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
P.O. Box 145801

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

RE: Sundry Notice - Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC
Wolverine Federal 17-8, API 43-041-30047
2020’ FSL, 1602’ FWL, NE/4 SW/4, Section 17, T23S, R1W, S.L.B.&M, Sevier
County, Utah

Dear Mr. Hunt:

The APD for the subject well received your approval on March 1, 2007. That approval
also included permission for a requested exception location per R649-3-2. The as-built
actual well spot for the subject well has been relocated 15 feet from the originally
permitted location to accommodate the drilling of multiple wells from the pad. The
enclosed copies of a Federal Sundry Notice and attachments document the change of
location.

The new location for this well remains more than 200’ from the center of the 40-acre
drilling unit, so the need for an exception to locating and siting requirements of R649-3-2
remains. The exception location for this well is requested because of the restrictive
topography of the area surrounding the preferred drilling site. Wolverine Gas and Oil
Company of Utah is the only operator within 460’ of the proposed location. Please accept
the plat submitted with the original exception location request to apply for this request.

Please accept the attached documents for the referenced well and treat them with
confidentially as previously requested for all information pertaining to this well.

Sincerely,
P RECEIVED
JUL 05 2007
Ellis M. Peterson — Senior Production Engineer

Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

One Riverfront Plaza * 55 Campau, NW. * Grand Rapids, M 49503-2616 + 616.458.1150 + FAX 616.458.0869



EXACT Engineering, Inc. www.exactengineering.com

415 S. Boston Ave., Suite 734, Tulsa, OK 74103 o (918) 599-9400 ¢ (918) 599-9401 (fax)

Steven R. Hash, P.E.
Registered Professional Engineer
stevehash@exactengineering.com

July 5, 2007

3

Mr. Al McKee C““iriaﬂ\i] \L
Bureau of Land Management L. 1 f

Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

Mr. Dustin Doucet

Utah Division of Qil, Gas & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Re: Drilling Update #1 - Wolverine Federal 17-8
Sec 17 T23S RO1W
Sevier Co, UT
API# 43-041-30047

Gentlemen,

On behalf of Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC, please find enclosed daily drilling reports for the
subject well from spud through July 4, 2007. We are presently testing BOPE after setting 13-3/8" surface casing
@ 1915’ and cementing to surface. We expect to alter our target point for the 9-5/8" intermediate casing point
from 10,600’ to approximately 7000°. Our Sundry Notice of Intent for same is forthcoming. We respectfully
request that the enclosed information remain _confidential.

Smcerely, ’

Steven R. Hash, P.E.

Enclosures

copy without enclosures via email to:
Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC: Helene Bardolph RECE'VED
EXACT Engineering, Inc. well file

JUL 06 2007
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING

Petroleum Engineering Consulting, Personnel & Jobsite Supervision
complete well design, construction & management, drilling, completion, production, pipelines, appraisals,
due diligence, acquisitions, procedures, temporary personnel and field supervision




Engineering and Supervision EXACT E n g i nee I‘i n g 3 I nc . (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & OIl Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWELL - CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
07/04/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Darren Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEFTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
7 NU BOPE 1,915 0 -0.00 #DIV/0! Kaibab 14,500
_ WUD DATA
DATE/TME DEPTH WT Vis PV YP GELS _ |FILTRATE] CAKE/32 ]| SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC | LCM
I
BITDATA
[BIT] SIZE | WMFG. TYPE TADG | SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd) ™ SUT | FOOTAGE | HOURS ROP MTA] APM ] WOB ] DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T] B G
#DIV/01
#DIV/0!
#DIV/0!
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPOMP PSI |
puMP | MANUFACTURER LNER | sTRoke| cAL/sTK | sem | aPm | avee | avoc | pume MOTOR DIFF HHP/N2 £CD DEPTH
NO. LENGTH|  100% PRESS. PsI SPM
1 |National 10P130f 6.0 10 35 0 0 1
2 [National 10P130] 6.0 10 | 35 0] o CONFIDENTIAL REPORT 2
3 0 3
0 I | I I D%
I BRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALCINFO |
Jsotrom Hote assemsLys] 4 LENGTH oD 1.0. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
Arapiean Co Man 435-979-2202
Mudlogger
Toolpusher
[EOTTOMS UP TIME]_ BEGAS | asg&]ﬁms T TAP GAS Last BOP Test
| { i Next BOP Test
SHOWS Last Safety Meeting 7/4
GAS UNITS FROM 10 ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill
Last Operate Pipe R
| Last Operate Blind R3
TOTAL 0.00 WW Last Operate Annular
[ STANG WT. BRAWT, PUWT, SOWT. ROT. TORQUE ; [ GLTOKE | KB ELEVATION [SURFCSG TNT CASING 1 TNT CASING 2 PROD CSG
| | | 5703 26 5,818 (1915) (7000) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL._| AZMUTH VD N+/S- | Es/W- |SECTION] DLS | TooL | MD | INCL AZIMUTH VD N+/S-_| Ev/W. |SECTION] DLS | _TooL
[ _ — DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM ]| 10 HRS TAST 24 HOURS:

0:00 § 1:30 | 1.50

Finish running csng. Ran 44 jts. 13 3/8, 68# {55, bic. Set @ 1915'

1:30 | 3:30 | 2.00

RU swedge wash to btm. Circ. 1 1/2 times csng volume.

330 ] 7:.00 { 3.50

RU cementers & cement, plug bumped @ 06:35, 650 psi.

7.00 | 11:00| 4.00

WOC. While woc cut off conductor & prepare for NU.

11:00| 15:00 | 4.00

Cut off & weld csng head on.

15:00| 0:00 | 9.00

NU BOPE DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

0:00

0:00

0:00 Cemented casing with 352 sks. Of lead cement CBM LITE standrd cbc lite blend w/salt,.100 LB BAG, poly-e-fl
0:00 Weight (Ib/gal) 10.50 Yeild (cuft/sk) 4.33 Water (gal/sk) 27.73

0:00 Follow with tail cement Weight 15.6 lb/gal. Yeild 1.19 cuft/sk Water 5.24gal/sk. 1% CACL
0:00 Displace with 280.5 bbls. H20 bumped plug pressure up to 650 psi. float held good

0:00 Pumped 20 bbls. Of cement to reserve pit. Cement did not drop stayed @ ground level.
0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00 This am Pressure testing BOPE,

0:00

0:00

Daily Total 24.00




Engineering and Supervision EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oll Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE APl SUPERVISOR
07/03/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Darren Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
6 Running 13 3/8 surface csng. 1,915 0 0.00 #DIV/0! Kaibab 14,500
MUD DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRATEI CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
7/3/8am 1915 9.2 35 5 13 o3 |s20| 2 6.25 tr 8.5 900 1,485 | 120
BIT DATA
(BT SZE MFG. TYPE TADC SERWAL NO. JETS (1/aznd") N OUT | TOOTAGE | WoURS ROP MTW [~WOB | DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B G
1 ]17.500{Russian] wissis | 417 | 20540906 |26|26|26|26 115 | 135 20 2.50 8.0 vlo45] 5 1)1 [
2|17.500] RR RFVG | 417 | MRS5451 |[28]|28]28 135 | 435 300 20.50 14.6 N| s0 5 |1]1 [
3 {17.500|Russian| wissis | 417 RR1 26| 26| 26]26 435 11915 | 1480 | 45.00 32.9 Ylo-100] 35 f1]1 I
#DIV/O!
HYDRAULICS SLOW PUMP PSI |
PUMP |  MANUFAGTURER LINER | STROKE| GAL/sTK | spm | apm | avor | avoe | pume MOTOR DIFF HHP/INZ ECD DEPTH
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM
1 |National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 120 | 420 1
2 _|National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 120 | 420 CONFIDENTIAL REPORT 2
3 0 3
840 | &1 | 651 ] 1450 | | smere | 953 ]
I BRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO |
IBOTTOM HOLE ASSEMELY#I 4 LENGTH QO.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
Im 1.50} 17.500 NP Arapiean Co Man 435-979-2202
Bit sub 2.68 8.875 np Mudlogger
6-8"DC 177.52|  8.000 2.94 Toolpusher
X0 300 7500 | 288 |ormmsormmemsms T s ——Tares—]| Last BOP Test
6- 6 1/2" DC 174.19]  6.563 2.75 25 | [ Next BOP Test
2 - 5" HWDP 61.21]  5.000 3.19 SHows Last Safety Meeting | 7/3
GAS UNITS FROM TO ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Dirill
Last Operate Pipe Ral
I Last Operate Blind R4
TOTAL w18V Last Operate Annular
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUHI GRD. ELEVATION GL TOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
100 51 120 | 8 | | s7es 25 5,818 (1800) (7000) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/§- E+ /W- SECTION] DLS TOOL l MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD Na+/S- E+ /W- | SECTION OLS TOOL
1,830] 0.25 1830 5 0 5 |0.03 /ertitraH
- _ — DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 1:30 | 150 POOH slowly, could not confirm steering arms were closed, had 50k drag
1:30 | 3:30 | 2.00 LD vertitrak system
3:30 | 4:00 | 0.50 Top drive maintenance
4:00 | 7:00 | 3.00 PU bit sub TIH. Wash thru bridge @ 1885. 8' fill
7:00 [ 11:30 | 4.50 Circ. & condition Wait on csng. Crew
11:30] 14:00 | 2.50 Make another wiper trip.No bridge, no fill. Wait on csng. Crew
14:00] 14:30 | 0.50 Circ. & condition Wait on csng. Crew
14:30| 15:30 | 1.00 POGH to run pipe, Csng. Crew showed up @ 3:15 pm: 12 hrs. late.
15:30] 17:00 | 1.50 RU csng crew, forgot to bring stabing board.
17:00| 19:00] 2.00 Make up guide shoe, shoe jt. Float collar & 2nd jt. Had trouble making up float collar without stabbing board.
19:00] 20:00 ] 1.00 Strap weld shoe & float collar.
20:00| 22:00 | 2.00 Start running csng. 14 jts.
22:00 23:00 [ 1.00 Fill pipe while RU stabbing board.
23:00| 0:00 | 1.00 Resume running csng.
0:00
0:00 Csng crew sheduled to be on location 3:am 7/3/07, did not show till 3:15pm 7/3/07
0:00
0:00 This am: pipe on btm. & cementing
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COS1S




Englineering and Supervision EXACT E ngineering, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oll Co of Utah, LLC DAI LY DR"—L'NG REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE APIE SUPERVISOR
07/02/07 Woilverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Darren Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
5 POOH to run 13 3/8 surface csng. 1,915 700 19.00 36.8 Kaibab 14,500
MUD DATA
[ DATETME | DEPTH WT vis PV P GELS  |FILTRATE] CAKERZ]  SOLIDS 'SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC | LoM
7/2/8am 1490 9.2 36 6 16 11/16 32.0 I 2 6.25 tr 8.5 900 1,485 110
BIT DATA
[ sze MFG. TVPE 1ADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/aznd) N SUT | FOOTAGE | FOUTS ROP MTR] RPM | WOB | DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T| B G
1 117.500|Russian] wLss15 | 417 | 20540906 |26{26]26|26 115 | 135 20 2.50 8.0 Y| 0-45 5
2]17.500] RR rRevé | 417 | MR5451 ]28]28|28 135 | 435 300 20.50 14.6 N} 50 5 |11 I
3 ]17.500[Russian] wLss15 | 417 RR1 26]26{26]26 435 | 1915 1480 45.00 32.9 Y|]0-100] 35
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMPPST |
PUMP | MANUFACTURER LNER | stroke| caL/stk | sem | aem | avor | avoc | pume | moTORODIFE HHP/INZ ECD DEPTH
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSt SPM
1 [National 10P130f 6.0 10 3.5 100 | 350 1
2 |National 10P130f 6.0 10 3.5 100 | 350 CONFIDENTIAL REPORT 2
3 0 3
ikl IGR i Rl = | o0 | &7
[ DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
IBOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY#I 3 LENGTH Q.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
oit 1.50] 17.500 NP Arapiean Co Man 435-979-2202
Vertitrak (motor) 36.73 9.500 NP Mudlogger
16 1/2" IBS 7.76 9.688 2.81 Toolpusher
Filter sub 561 9625 NP_{trorromsormoe—seas T s ——TRr Last BOP Test
X0 2.75]  8.000 3.25 10 | | | Next BOP Test
|Float sub 257 7313 NP SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 7/2
Shock sub 9.93] 8.000 3.25 GAS UNITS FROM 0 ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill
6-8"DC,177.52/X0,3.09 180.61| 7.75/7.5 |2.94/2.94 Last Operate Pipe Ral
6-61/2"DC,174.19/2-5"H 235.40] 6.5/5 [2.75/3.19 Last Operate Blind R4
TOTAL w28l Last Operate Annular!
| STRING WT. BHA WT, PUWT. SOWT. ROT. TORQUEJl GRD. ELEVATION GLTOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 P! C!
100 51 120 | 8 | {5703 25 5,818 (1800) (7000) {14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/§- E+/W- |SECTION] DLS TooL [ MmD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- | SECTION] DLS TOOL
1,830] 0.25 1830 5 0 5 0.03 /ertitra“
- — — DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 13:00 | 13.00 Drill & survey 1215 to 1679
13:00| 13:30 | 0.50 Rig service
13:30] 19:30 ] 6.00 Drill & survey 1679 to 1915
19:30] 20:00 | 0.50 Circ. & condition for wiper trip
20:00 21:30 | 1.50 Work on surface gear trying to confirm closure of steering arms on vertitrak
21:30] 0:00 | 2.50 POOH slowly, could not confirm steering arms were closed, had 50k drag
0:00
0:00 Got out of hole & steering arms were closed.
0:00 will LD vertitrak & finish wiper trip.
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 This am TIH after laying down directional ass.
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COS 1S




Engineering and Supervision EXACT E n g i neer i n g ) I ncC. : (918) 599-9400 office

Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oll Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
07/01/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Darren Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
4 Drilling 1,215 780 23.50 33.2 Kaibab 14,500
MUD DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRATE! CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
7/1/8am 639 8.9 35 7 12 9/14 32.0 I 2 4.00 tr 9.6 900 1,485 120
BITDATA
(BT SZE | Mo, TVPE TADC | SERIALNO. JETS (1/32nd) W] OUT | FOOIAGE | HOURS ROP MTR]  AEM FVW DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B G
1 }117.500]Russian| wissis | 417 20540906 |26]26|26{26 115 135 20 2.50 8.0 Y| 0-45 5
2117.500] RR RFVG 417 MR5451 [28]|28({28 135 435 300 20.50 14.6 N| 50 5 111 |
3 ]17.500{Russian| wLss15 | 417 RR1 26126]26]26 435 780 26.00 30.0 Y{0-100] 35
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMP PST |
PUMP | MANUFACTURER LNER | sTRokE| cAL/sTk | spm | apm | avor | avoe | pume MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM
National 10P130) 6.0 10 3.5 100 | 350 1
2 |National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 | 100 ] 350 CONFIDENT/AL REPORT 2
3 0 3
700 | 61 fesmi] 1000 250 | | 910 |
1 DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
lBO'l'I’OM HOLE ASSEMBLY’I 3 LENGTH 0Q.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 1.50 17.500 NP Arapiean Co Man 435-979-2202
Vertitrak (motor) 36.73 9.500 NP Mudlogger
16 1/2" IBS 7.76 9.688 2.81 Toolpusher
Filter sub 561 9625 NP rorromsorme—srme T —TAP@s— Last BOP Test
X0 2.75]  8.000 3.25 10 | | [ Next BOP Test
Float sub 257] 7313 NP SHows Last Safety Meeting | 7/1
Shock sub 9.93 8.000 3.25 GAS UNITS FROM TO ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill
6-8"DC,177.52/X0,3.09 180.61) 7.75/7.5 |2.94/2.94 Last Operate Pipe Ra)
6-61/2"DC,174.19/2-5"H 235.40 6.5/5 2.75/3.19 Last Operate Blind R3
TOTAL 482.86 Last Operate Annulg_q
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUH| GRD. ELEVATION GLTOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
90 51 105 80 I [l 5,793 25 5,818 (1800) (7000) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+ / W- SECTION; DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+ /W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
= _ _ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 15:00 ] 15.00 Drill & survey 435 to 924
15:00) 15:30 | 0.50 Rig service
15:30] 0:00 | 8.50 Drill & survey 924 to 1215
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 This am drilling @ 1489
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

Daily Total 24.00




Engineering and Supervision EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE API# SUPERVISOR
06/30/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Darren Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME . ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
3 Drilling 435 300 20.50 14.6 Kaibab 14,500
MUD DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS m CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
6/30/8am 135 8.4 31 5 8 6/9 nc I 2 1.00 tr 11.0 900 1,485 120
BITDATA
(BIT] SZE | WFG. TYPE TADG SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd") ™ BUT | FOOTAGE | HOURS ROP MTR] RFM | WOB | DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T 8 G
1 ]17.500|Russian] wLss15 417 20540906 |26]26]26|26 115 135 20 2.50 8.0 Y| 0-45 5
2]17.500f RR RFVG M7 MR5451 |28|28]28 135 435 300 20.50 14.6 N|] 50 5 111 |
#DIV/0!
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMP PSI |
PUMP | MANUFACTURER LNER | STROKE] aaL/sTk | sem | oM | avor | avoc | pump | moToRDIFF DEPTH
NO. LENGTH 100% PARESS. PsSI SPM
1 |National 10P130| 6.0 10 3.5 100 | 350 1
2 |National 10P130| 6.0 10 35 | 100 | 350 CONFIDENTIAL REPORT 2
3 0 3
) 10| o [esmtow] a0 | | I
[ BRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
'BOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY#I 2 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
Bit 1.50 17.500 np Co Man 435-979-2202
Bit sub 2.68 8.875 np I Mudlogger
6-8"DC 177.52 8.000 2.94 IToolpusher
X0 3.09]  7.500 2.8 _|morowsurmme—sems T ——Arms—]| Last BOP Test
6-61/2"DC 174.19]  6.563 2.75 | [ Next BOP Test
2 - 5" HWDP 61.21 5.000 3.19 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 6/30
GAS UNITS FROM TO ROP (FT/HR} Last BOP D”"
Last Operate Pipe R}
Last Operate Blind R4
TOTAL 420.19 %//////////%%/////% Last Operate Annular
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SOWT. ROT. TORQUHI GRD. ELEVATION GL TOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG |
83 51 85 | 80 | I 5703 25 5,818 (1800) (10800) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD_| INCL._ | AZIMUTH TVD Ne/S-_ | E+/W- |SECTION] DLS ] TooL | _MD ] INCL AZIMUTH VD N+/S._] E+/W- [SECTION] OLS | TooL
250 | 0.50 510 | 0.15
385 | 0.75
| — — DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 22:00 | 22.00 Drill & survey 135 to 435
22:00| 0:00 | 2.00 Trip for vertitrak
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0.00
0:00 This am drilling @ 734
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE F'OR ESTIMATED DRV HOLE COSTS




Engineering and Supervision EXACT E n g i nee ri ng ) I NncC. (918) 599-9400 office

Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oll Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWELL - CONTRAGTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE = R 'SUPERVISOR
06/29/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Darren Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
2 WOC 135 0 0.00 #DIV/0! Kaibab 14,500
MOD DATA
DATE/TIME DE’PTH WT VIS PV YP GELS m CAKES2 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
6.3 115 8.4 30
BITDATA
W’TIZE MFG. TYPE TADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1732nd") ™ CUT | TOOTAGE | HOURS ROP MTR] RPM ] WOB | OULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B G
1 |17.500|Russian] wissis | 417 | 20540906 |26]26]|26)26 115 | 135 20 2.50 8.0 Y|lo45] 5
#DIV/O!
#DIV/O!
#DIV/O!
HYDRAULICS SLOW PUMP PSI |
PUMP | MANUFACTURER LNER | sTROKE| GAL/sTK | spm | apm | avopr | avoc | pump MOTOR DIFF DEPTH
NO, LENGTH 100% PRESS. PS| SPM
1 |National 10P130] 6.0 10 3.5 95 | 333 1
2 [National 10P130{ 6.0 10 3.5 0 0 CONFIDENTIAL REPORT 2
3 0 3
27,2/ R [ 1 1 I I [ D
DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
[BOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLW‘I 2 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
{bit 1.50]  17.500 Co Man 435-979-4644
directional assy 65.00 9.500 np Mudlogger
3- 8" Dc 86.68]  8.000 2,94 Toolpusher
[EoTTONS UP TIME] _BGGAS | stgc%ems T TP GAS Last BOP Test
[ Next BOP Test
SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 6/29
GAS UNITS FROM TO ROP (FT/HR) L.ast BOP Drill
Last Operate Pipe Raj
Last Operate Blind R4
TOTAL 153.18 Last Operate Annular
STRING WT. BHAWT. PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUY| GRD. ELEVATION GLTOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
18 18 18 18 | | 5703 25 5,818 (1800) (10600) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- | SECTION: DLS TOOL
[ _ . DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 2:30 | 2.50 Make preperation to cement conductor,mousehole & cellar. Wait on cementers
2:30 | 4:00 | 1.50 Pump 450 sks. Premium cement w/ 3% cacl
4:00 | 0:00 | 20.00 WOC
0:00 While woc, nipple up conductor, PU bit, bit sub, 2- 8" dc RIH tag cement @ 60'
0:00 12:00 drill 10’ cement 60 to 70, cement still green.
0:00 16:00 drilled 70 to 75 cement still not firm
0:00 18:00 drilled 75 to 85 cement firm but not hard.
0:00 20:00 drilled 85 to 95 cement firm but stili not hard.
0:00 22:00 drilled 95 to 105 cement still not hard.
0:00 24:00 drilled 105 to 115 cement still not hard. After 20 hrs. woc. Washed 20" to 135', no cement.
0:00 start drilling w/ 4K wt. 45 rpm, pumping 200 gpm, & a 32 vis for mud.
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 No washes in cellar or mousehole.
0:00
0:00 This 10:00 am drilling @ 268'
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00




Engineering and Supervision EXACT E ng i nee ri n g ’ 'n C. (918) 599-9400 office

Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE APl# SUPERVISOR
06/28/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Darren Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
1 Wait on cementers 135 20 2.50 8.0 Kaibab 14,500
— MUD DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRATEI CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
/27 8:00a] 115 8.4 30 |
BIT DATA
[BIT] SZE | MFG. TVPE TADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd) N BUT | FOOTAGE | HOURS FOP MTR] RPM ] WOB ] DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B G
1 |17.500|Russian] wissis | 417 | 20540906 |26]26|26|26 115 | 135 20 2.50 8.0 Ylod45]| 5
#DIV/O!
#DIV/0!
#DIV/O|
HYDRAULICS SLOW PUMP PST |
PUMP | MANUFACTURER UNER | stroke| cAL/sTK | spm | aem | avoe | avbc | Pump MOTOR DIFF DEPTH
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM
1 |National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 95 | 333 1
2 |National 1013 _60 | 10 | 35 | o0 | o CONFIDENTIAL REPORT [
3 0 3
333 [ T 1 I l I i
| DRILC STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO_____|
IBOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLV‘!I 1 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MO TVD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 1.50]  17.500 Co Man 435-979-4644
directional assy 65.00 9.500 np Mudlogger
3- 8" D¢ 86.68]  8.000 2.94 Toolpusher
5 1 as@éﬁﬁm T TRIF GAS Last BOP Test
| [ [ Next BOP Test
SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 6/28
GAS UNITS FROM TO ROP (FT/HR) Last Bop Dn“
Last Operate Pipe Raj
| Last Operate Blind R
TOTAL 153.18 %////////////%%/////% Last Ograte Annular
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUY| GRD. ELEVATION GLTOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG |
18 18 18 | 18 | s57ss 25 5,818 (1800) (10600) {14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- [ SECTION DLS TOOL
[ _ _ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 10:00 ] 10.00 Waiting on directional tools
10:00] 13:00 | 3.00 PU Vertitrack assembly
13:00] 14:00 | 1.00 RU vertitrack surface gear, adjust track for top drive
14:00{ 16:30 | 2.50 Drill 115 to 135, 95 spm 5 k wt. no rot. - START DRLG @ 2pm 6/28/2007
16:30| 16:30 | 0.00 conductor hole comunicated with mouse hole & washed into cellar
16:30] 0:00 | 7.50 Make preperation to cement conductor,mousehole & cellar.
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 This am WOC, pumped 450 sks. premium cement with 3 % cacl
0:00
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00




Engineering and Supervision

EXACT Engineering, Inc.

(918) 599-9400 office

Operator: Wolverine Gas & Ol Co of Utah, LLC

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

24 hrs - midnight to midnight

DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE APk SUPERVISOR
06/27/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Darren Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
0 Wait on tools 115 #DIV/0I Kaibab 14,500
MUD BATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS Iml CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
27 8:00a] 115 |
BIT DATA
(B Szt MFG. TYPE TADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd") "N OUT | FOOTAGE ] HOURS ROP MTR| RPM ]| WOB | DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA AT+MTR T B G
1117.500 115 #DIV/0! Y
#DIV/0I
#DIV/01
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SLOW PUMP PSI |
PUMP |  MANUFACTURER UNER | sTROKE| GaL/sTK | spm | apm | avoe | avoc | pume MOTOR DIFF DEPTH
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PS) SPM
1 [National 10P130] 6.0 10 3.5 120 | 420 1
2 [National 10P130| 6.0 10 35 | 120 | 420 CONFIDENT/AL REPORT 2
3 0 3
] s [ 1 1 l |
DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
[BOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY#I 1 LENGTH 0.D. 1.0. FORMATION MO TVD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 17.500 Co Man 435-979-4644
directional assy 9.500 Mudlogger
Toolpusher
TAS 1 stc? R T TRIE GAS Last BOP Test
| [ [ Next BOP Test
SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 6/27
GAS UNITS FROM TO ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP DI’I“
Last Operate Pipe Raj
Last Operate Blind R
TOTAL| 0.00 Last Operate Annular
STRING WT, BHA WT. PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUH| GRD. ELEVATION GLTOKB KB ELEVATION [SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 me
[ 5,793 25 5,818 (1800) {10600) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+ /W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD Na+/S- E+/W- | SECTION, LS TOOL
[ _ — DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00
0:00 | 18:00 | 18.00 Finish rigging up top drive; finish misc rig up; set trailers, run pumps, expect spud late tonight
18:00| 0:00 { 6.00 Start operating dayrate @ 18:00 hrs 6/27/2007
0:00 Waiting on directional tools
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 This am wait on tools.
0:00
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00




Engineering and Supervision EXACT Eng ineeri ng, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Ol Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight

DATE TWELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE | SPUD DATE APIF SUPERVISOR
06/26/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Darren Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
0 RURT 115 #DIV/O! Kaibab 14,500
. MUD BATX
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PY YP GELS FILTRATEI CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES CALCIUM LCM
/27 8:00ar] 125 I
BIT DATA
[BT] SIZE | MFG. | TVPE TADC | SERIALNO. JETS (1/32nd") ™ OUT | FOOTAGE | HOURS. ROP MTR] RPM ] WOB | DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B [<]
1]117.500 115 #DIV/0! Y
#DIV/0!
#DIV/0!
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SLOW PUMP PSI |
PUMP | MANUFACTURER UNER | STROKE| GAL/sTK | sPm | aPwm | avop | avoc | pump MOTOR DIFF DEPTH
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM
1 |National 10P130) 6.0 10 3.5 120 | 420 1
National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 | 120 | 420 CONFIDENTIAL REPORT 2
0 3
840 [ [ | I I | ¥
DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
BOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY#I 1 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 17.500 Co Man 435-979-4644
Mudlogger
Toolpusher
[EOTTOMS UP TIME] BG GAS ] GKS(%F}QEAS T TRIPGAS Last BOP Test
| ! | Next BOP Test
SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 6/26
GAS UNITS FROM 10 ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill
Last Operate Pipe Raf
| | Last Operate Blind R:i
TOTAL 0.00 7////////////%%/////% Last O’ﬂaie Annugdﬁ_
[ STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SOWT. ROT. TORQUE] GRD. ELEVATION GLTOKB KB ELEVATION [SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 ROD CSG
| | | 5703 25 5,818 (1800) (10600) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+ /W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
_ — _ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 On report
0:00 Rigging up rotary tools; rig up top drive; nipple up conductor & flowline; fili pits
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 0.00




Engineering and Supervision EXACT Eng i neeri ng y Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE AT SUPERVISOR
06/16/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Darren Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
0 set conductor 115 #DIV/0l Kaibab 14,500
MUD DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRATE[ CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES CALCIUM LCM
/27 8:00ar] 125
[ — — BITDATA I — E— 1
:g FZ’E MFG. TYPE ;)[I))CE SERIAL NO. JETZ{;/::nd) IN ouT FOOTA( HOURS ROP MTR] mimn wos Tl)ULLBCONDﬂlON
1117.500 #DIV/OI Y
#DIV/O!
#DIV/O1
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMP PST |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE | GAL/STK SPM GPM AVDP | AVDC PUMP MOTOR DIFF DEPTH
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSH SPM
1 |National 10P130f 6.0 10 35 120 | 420 1
2 [National10P13d 60 | 10 | 35 | 120|420 CONFIDENTIAL REPORT [
3 0 3
840 [ 1 I I [
I BRILC STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
IBOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY#I 1 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 17.500 Co Man 435-979-4644
]Mudlogger
Toolpusher
e — Iy — Last BOP Test
| Next BOP Test
SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 6/16
GAS UNITS FROM TO ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill
Last Operate Pipe Ra]
Last Operate Blind R4
TOTAL, 0.00 Last Operate Annular
[ STRINGWT. | BRAWT, PUWT. SOWT. ROT. TORQUH[ GRD. ELEVATION | GL TOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
[ 5702 25 5,818 (1800) (10600) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+ /W- SECTION| DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N4+/8- E+/W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
[ — _ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 FIRST REPORT
0:00 notified BLM & UDOGM on 6/15/2007 of pending spud
0:00 6/16/2007 - Pete Martin Drig drilled 90 ft of 30" hole and set 20" conductor csg 90' BGL or 115' KB; hit water a
0:00 Employee Michael McDonald sustained severed thumb while stabbing casing; transported
0:00 to local hospital for treatment; LTA report to follow
0:00 Drilled rat & mouse and installed litewall liners
0:00 Cemented 20" with 14 yds of redi-mix cement; off report waiting on drlg rig from Milburn 25-1
0:00 Filed UDOGM Entity Action form 6 - notice of spud date 6/16/2007
0:00
0:00 Well information
0:00 API# 43-041-30047
0:00 Casing Pgm: 13-3/8" @ 1800'; 9-5/8" @ 10,600'; 4-1/2" @ 14,500'
0:00 Permit depth: 14,500'
0:00 BLM lease
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 0.00
SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTINATED DRY HOLE COSTS




EXACT Engineering, Inc. www.exactengineering.com

415 S. Boston Ave., Suite 734, Tulsa, OK 74103 « (918) 599-9400 = (918) 599-9401 (fax)

Steven R. Hash, P.E.
Registered Professional Engineer
stevehash@exactengineering.com

July 20, 2007

Mr. Al McKee

Bureau of Land Management Cr} A , DE ! ‘I'
Utah State Office CNF ] | ’_
& -

P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

Mr. Dustin Doucet

Utah Division of Qil, Gas & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Re: Drilling Update #2 - Wolverine Federal 17-8
Sec 17 T23S RO1W
Sevier Co, UT
APl# 43-041-30047

Gentlemen,

On behalf of Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC, please find enclosed daily drilling reports for the
subject well from July 5, 2007 through July 19, 2007. We are presently drilling 12-1/4" hole at 6472’ and are
considering setting 9-5/8” casing through the Navajo 1 at 7000’ instead of near 10,600’ per our application, thus
our Sundry Notice of Intent is enclosed. We respectfully request that the enclosed information remain
confidential.

Sincerely,

SR T2l

Steven R. Hash, P.E.

Enclosures

copy without enclosures via email to:
Wolverine Gas & Qil Co of Utah, LLC:  Helene Bardolph

EXACT Engineering, Inc. well file RECE'VED
JUL 2 5 2007

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

Petroleum Engineering Consulting, Personnel & Jobsite Supervision
complete well design, construction & management, drilling, completion, production, pipelines, appraisals,
due diligence, acquisitions, procedures, temporary personnel and field supervision




Engineering and Supervision EXACT Eng ineeri ng, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWELL CONTRAGTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE APW SUPERVISOR
07/19/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 DL Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
22 Drilling 6,472 312 22.00 14.2 Kaibab 14,500
~MUD DATA
WME DE_PTT'I WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRATa CAKE2 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
V/19/7:30an] 6253 10.5+ 38 10 11 712 7.0 I 2 3.75 tr 10.2 200,000 | 330,000 | 1650 0
BITDATA
[BIT] SIZE MFG. TYPE TADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd") 19 SOT ] FOOTAGE | HOUBS ROP MTW%B DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B G
5112.250] Reed |M4249POH| 537 WP6106 |28]28]28 5469 | 6125 597 41.50 14.4 Y|0/110]|38-45| 8 { E |
6 | 12.250] Smith |Fs70DCPS] 647 PC3896 |28]28]28]28 6125 347 28.00 12.4 Y| 0/110] 38-50
#DIV/0!
#DIV/0!
HAYDRAULICS — SLOW PUMP PSI |
PUMP | MANUFACTURER UNER | sTroke| GaLsstk | sem | apm | avoer | avbc | pume MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH | 5980
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. Psi SPM 35
1 |National 10P130; 6.0 10 3.5 96 336 1 410
2 |National 10P130 6.0 10 | 35 | 96 | 338 CONFIDENTIAL REPORT 2 | 410
3 0 3
672 | 131 lisz-ie 2000 | 250 | o4s | 1070 | 200077
I DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC. CENERACINFO |
BTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLVRI 1 1 LENGTH 0o.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 1.50 12.250 NP Arapian 4,050 4,050 ss, sh, lime, anhd. Co Man 435-979-2202
Vertitak motor wfilter syl 38.63 9.500 np Twin Creek 5,611 5,611 Mudlogger
%0, fs, 11 3/4’ stabilizer 11.84 8.000 2.94 Navajio 5,901 5,901 ss Toolpusher
Shock sub 993  8.000 2.56 | imorromsTr e R LI ——Are—] Last BOP Test 7/5
6 - 8" DG / XO sub 180.57]  8.000 2.94 565 | 6 | 25 i na Next BOP Test 8/4
10-61/2"DC 300.88 6.500 2.75 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting 718
Jar 32.64 6.500 2.75 GAS UNITS FROM 0 ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill 718
2- 61/2"DC 58.30 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ral 7/18
2 - 5" HWDP 61.21 5.000 3.19 Last Operate Blind R4 7/18
TOTAL 695.50 Last Operate Annularl 7/18
STRING WT. BHAWT. PUWT. SOWT. ROT. TORQUH] GRD. ELEVATION GL TOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 P!
200,000 | 74,900 [ 210,000 195000 | 0 || 5793 26 5,819 1,915 (7000) (14500)
— SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- |SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/8- E+ /W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
| — — DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 11:30 | 11.50 Drill & survey from 6160 to 6307
11:30] 13:30 | 2.00 Repair pump, replace 2 valves & seats #2 pump, 1 valve & seat #1 pump
13:30] 0:00 | 10.50 Drill & survey 6307 to 6472
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 RECEIVED
0:00 i
0:00 1 2 5 2001
0:00 o
0:00 o
0:00 06:00 pooh for bit @ 6520 DIV OF OIL, GAS & MINING
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
SFE ATTACHED COSTDETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




Englineering and Supervision EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Ol Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE IWELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
07/18/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 DL Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PAOGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
21 Drilling 6,160 94 12.00 7.8 Kaibab 14,500
MUD DATA
™~ DATE/TIME DEPTH WT vis PV P GELS | FILTRATE] CAKEG2 | SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC | oM
p/18/7:30an] 6125 10.4+ 39 11 12 7113 60 | 2 3.25 tr 104 | 200,000 | 330,000 | 1650] ©
BITDATA
[BIT] SIZE MFG. TPE TADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd") W] OUT | FOOTAGE | HOURS ROP. MTF] RPM ] WOB ] DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T -] G
5 [12.250] Reed |macagpon]| 537 | WP6106 |28|28|28 5469 | 6125 | 597 41.50 14.4 Y|0/110}38-45| 8| E| |
6 {12.250} Smith |rs7opces] 647 | PC3896 |28|28|28|28 6125 35 6.00 5.8 Y| 0/110] 38-50
#DIV/0!
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMPPSI |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE| GAL/STK SPM GPM AVDP AV DC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH 5980
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 35
1 |National 10P130| 6.0 10 35 96 | 336 1 410
2 INatonaitop13d, 60 | 10 | a5 | s 1sw| CONFIDENTIAL REPORT | 2| 410
3 0 3
) ere | o sersl e [ a0 | o [ v | V77707 A
I BRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERACINFO |
IBOTI'OM HOLE ASSEMBLWI 1 1 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 1.50]  12.250 NP Arapian 4,050 4,050 ss, sh, lime, anhd.  [[Co Man 435-979-2202
Vertitak motor w/filter su 38.63 9.500 np Twin Creek 5,611 5,611 Mudlogger
x0, fs, 11 3/4' stabilizer 11.84|  8.000 2.94 Navajio 5,901 5,901 ss Toolpusher
Shock sub 993  8.000 256 |orromsor TR B S ——mres—| Last BOP Test 7/5
6 - 8" DC / XO sub 180.57|  8.000 2.94 56.5 21 34 71 Next BOP Test 8/4
10- 6 1/2" DC 300.88]  6.500 2.75 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 7/18
Jar 32.64] 6.500 2.75 GAS UNITS FROM 0 ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill 7/18
2- 61/2"DC 58.30]  6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra| 7/18
2-5" HWDP 61.21]  5.000 3.19 Last Operate Blind R{ 7/18
TOTAL 695.50 Last Operate Annular] 7/18
[ STRINGWT. | BHAWT. | PUWT. SOWT. ROT. TORQUH[ GRD. ELEVATION | _GL TOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD GSG__|
180,000 | 74,900 192 170 | o || 793 26 5,819 1,915 (7000) (14500)
— SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+ /W- SECTION} DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/8- E+ /W- } SECTION DLS TOOL
[ _ _ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 6:00 | 6.00 Drill & survey from 6066' to 6125'
6:00 ] 730 [ 150 Circ. Bottoms up pump pill retract arms on vertitak
7:30 | 12:30 | 5.00 Trip out close blind rams
12:30( 13:30 | 1.00 Change shock sub & bit
13:30( 14:30 | 1.00 TIH w/ BHA surface test vertitrak
14:30| 15:00 | 0.50 Change saver sub & corr. Rings
15:00| 18:00 | 3.00 TIH
18:00| 0:00 | 6.00 Drill & survey from 6125 to 6160
0:00
0:00
0:00 Well did not take any fluid in last 24 hours
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 06:00 Drilling @ 6235
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
—SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COS1S




Engineering and Supervision EXACT Eng ineeri ng, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Ol Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE | SPUD DATE AP 'SUPERVISOR
07/17/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
20 Drilling 6,066 267 18.00 14.8 Kaibab 14,500
_ MUD DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRATE| CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
f/17/7:30an] 5932 10.4+ 40 12 13 8/13 60 | 2 3.25 tr 10.0 | 200,000 | 330,000 | 1650 ©
BIT DATX
[BIT] Szt MFG. TYPE TADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd) W OUT | FOOTAGE | HOURS ROP MTR] RPM ] WOB | DULL GONDITION |
NO. CODE or TFA RAT+MTR T] B G
5 ]12.250| Reed |m4249pon| 537 | WP6106 |28|28|28 5469 597 35.50 16.8 Y |0/110]38-45
#DIV/O!
#DIV/0!
#DIV/ol
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMPPSI |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE{ GAL/STK SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH 5980
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSl SPM 35
1 |National 10P130| 6.0 10 35 96 | 336 1 410
2 |National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 96 | 336 CONFIDENTIAL REPORT 2 | 410
3 0 3
i er2 | e el eow | s | oes | e |
[ DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERACINFO |
IBO'ITOM HOLE ASSEMBLYkl 10 LENGTH O.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 1.50] 12.250 NP Arapian 4,050 4,050 ss, sh, lime, anhd. _ }ICo Man 435-979-2202
Vertitak motor wifilter su 38.63 9.500 np Twin Creek 5,611 5,611 IMudlogger
x0, fs, 11 3/4' stabilizer 11.84 8.000 2.94 Toolpusher
Shock sub 9.93| 8.000 256 |lmorroverme—mrms T oW — T Last BOP Test 7/5
6 - 8" DC / XO sub 180.57]  8.000 2.94 % | 8 | 15 | na Next BOP Test 8/4
10-61/2" DC 300.88]  6.500 2.75 SHoWs Last Safety Meeting | 7/17
Jar 32.64| 6.500 2.75 GAS UNITS FROM 0 ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill 714
2-61/2"DC 58.30|  6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra] 7/13
2-5"HWDP 61.21]  5.000 3.19 Last Operate Blind R 7/16
TOTAL 695.50 Last Operate Annular] 7/14
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SOWT. ROT. TORQUH GRD. ELEVATION GLTOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
176,000 | 74,900 186,000 166,000 | © 5,793 26 5,819 1,915 (7000) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION{ DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+ /W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
[ _ _ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 11:00 | 11.00 Drill & survey from 5799' to 5980’
11:00] 12:00 | 1.00 Service rig recal down hole tools
12:00] 13:30 | 1.50 Drill & survey from 5980’ to 6003'
13:30| 14:00 | 0.50 Recal down hole tools due to motor over heating
14:00] 18:00 ] 4.00 Drill & survey from 6003’ to 6042’
18:00| 22:30 | 4.50 Repair rig clean radiaters on all three motors
22:30] 0:00 | 1.50 Drill & survey from 6042' to 6066
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 Well did not take any fluid in last 24 hours
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 6123 Drilling ahead @ 0600 hour.
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOH ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




Engineering and Supervision

EXACT Engineering, Inc.

(918) 599-9400 office

Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

24 hrs - midnight to midnight

DATE TWELL CONTRAGTOR COUNTY, STATE | SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
07/16/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
19 Drilling 5,799 330 17.50 18.9 Kaibab 14,500
— _ MUD DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRATE] CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
V/16/7:30an] 5471 10.4+ 38 11 12 9/13 8.8 2 3.25 tr 10.4 200,000 | 330,000 | 1650 0
BIT DATA
[BIT] St MFG. TVPE TADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd") N GUT | FOOTAGE | HOURS ROP MTF] RPM | WOB | DULL GONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T] 8B G
4.112.250] Securty| erazeon | 517 | 719749 |24|24]|24|22 5054 | 5469 | 414 46.00 9.0 Y|0110]40/52| 3] 8] i
5 112.250] Reed |m4249POH| 537 WP6106 |28|28|28 5469 330 17.50 18.9 Y] 0/105 | 35-48
#DIV/O!
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMPPST |
PUMP | MANUFACTURER uner | stroke| GaL/stk | sem | oPm | avor | avpc | PuMp | MoTOR DIFF HHP/INZ ECD DEPTH | 5737
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 35
1 |National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 96 | 336 1 410
2 |National 10P130| 6.0 10 35 | 96 | 336 CONF IDENTIAL RE POR T 410
3 0
672 | 131 |29t 2775 | 220 | os1 [ 1065 ]
BRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALCINFO |
BOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY’I 10 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 1.50] 12.250 NP Arapian 4,050 4,050 ss, sh, lime, anhd.  [|Co Man 435-979-2202
Vertitak motor wfilter sul 38.63 9.500 np Twin Creek 5,611 5,611 Mudlogger
x0, fs, 11 3/4' stabilizer 11.84 8.000 2.94 Toolpusher
Shock sub 9.93]  8.000 2.56 S L\ — Last BOP Test 7/5
6 - 8" DC/ XO sub 180.57]  8.000 2.94 6 | 8 | 15 na Next BOP Test 8/4
10-61/2"DC 300.88] 6.500 2.75 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 7/17
Jar 32.64| 6.500 2.75 GAS UNITS FROM 0 ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill 714
2- 61/2"DC 58.30 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra] 7/13
2 - 5" HWDP 61.21]  5.000 3.19 Last Operate Blind R4 7/16
TOTAL 69550 % Last Operate Annular| 7/14
[STRING WT. BHA WT. PU WT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUET GRD. ELEVATION GLTOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING t INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
174,000 | 74,900 188,000 | 160,000 | 0 || 5703 26 5,819 1,915 (7000) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/ W- SECTION| DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+ /W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
- _ _ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 1:30 | 1.50 Trip out work blind rams
1:30 | 3:00 | 1.50 Change out Vertitak & Bit open blind rams
3:00 | 4:00 | 1.00 Trip in bha.
400 | 4:30 | 050 Repair top drive changed out o-ring that was leaking
4:30 | 6:00 | 1.50 Trip in fill pipe
6:00 | 6:30 | 0.50 Fill pipe wash & ream 41' to bottom no fill
6:30 | 0:00 | 17.50 Drill & survey from 5469’ to 5799'
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 Well did not take any fluid in last 24 hours
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 5882' Drilling @ 0500 hour.
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00




Engineering and Supervision EXACT E ng ineerin g ’ I ncC. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
[DATE TWELL CONTRACTOR GOUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
07/15/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
18 Trip out 5,469 149 19.50 7.6 Kaibab 14,500
MUD DATA
[ DATENTME DEPTH WT Vis & P GELS _ |FILTRATE] CAKERZ] _SOLIDS SAND PH GHLORIDES SALT CALC | LCM
y/15/7:30an] 5400 10.4 38 12 13 9/13 8.0 I 2 3.00 tr 10.4 200,000 | 330,000 { 1650 0
BIT DATA
[BIT] SEZE WFG. TVPE JADC SERIAL NO. T JETS (Taznd) N GOT | FOOTAGE | HOURS ROP MTR] RPM | WOB ] DULL CONDITION
NO, CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B G
4 |12.250| Securty| erazcop | 517 | 719749  |24|24|24]22 5054 | 5469 | 414 46.00 9.0 Y | 07110 40/52
#DIV/0I
#DIV/0!
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS —  SLOWPUNP PSI |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE | GAL/STK SPM GPM AV DP AVDC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH 5403
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 35
1 |National 10P130f 6.0 10 3.5 93 | 326 1 | 400
2 INational 10p130]_60 | 10 | 35 | 98 lses| CONFIDENTIAL REPORT | 2| 4w
3 0 3
) ) 51 | 1o haried 20| ses | oss | ose | D
{ DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC NENACTRED
IBOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY&I 9 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 150 12.250 NP Arapian 4,050 4,050 ss, sh, lime, anhd.  [[Co Man 435-979-2202
Vertitak motor wfilter sul 38.91 9.500 np Mudlogger
x0, fs, 11 3/4' stabilizer 11.84 8.000 2.94 [Toolpusher
Shock sub 9.93]  8.000 2.56_|lmorromsur e —meam T s —— s Last BOP Test 7/5
6 - 8" DG / XO sub 180.57|  8.000 2.94 %6 | 8 | 15 na Next BOP Test 8/4
10-61/2"DC 300.88]  6.500 2.75 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 7/16
Jar 3264 6.500 2.75 GAS UNITS FROM O ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill 7114
2- 61/2'DC 56.30| 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra] 7/13
2 - 5" HWDP 61.21] 5000 | 3.9 Last Operate Blind R4 7/13
TOTAL, 693.78 %////////////%%///////////, Last Operate Annularl 7/14
[ STRING WT. BHA WT, PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUH| GRD. ELEVATION GL TOKB KB ELEVATION [SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
170,000 | 74900 | 190000 | 160000 | o | 5793 2 5,819 1,915 (7000) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL AZIMUTH VD N+/S- E+ /W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- | SECTION. DLS TOOL
- - — DALY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 8:00 | 8.00 Drill & survey 5320' to 5403'
8:00 | 8:30 | 0.50 Service rig -- top drive

8:30 { 19:30{ 11.00

Drill & survey 5403’ to 5467"

19:30{ 20:30 | 1.00

Change middel liner & swab # 2 pump

20:304 21:00 | 0.50

Drill & survey 5467' to 5469’

21:00} 22:00 | 1.00

Circ. Clean hole pump pill

22:00} 0:00 | 2.00

Trip out to change Vertitak motor

0:00

0:00

0:00

At 5326’ hole started taking fluid sealed hole after mixing & pumping 80 bbls mud with 52 sks of calcium carbo

0:00

Lost a total of 125 bbls. Of fluid.

0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00

Trip in 0500 hour

0:00

0:00

Daily Total

24.00




Engineering and Supervision EXACT E ng i neer i ng ’ lnc- (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oll Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE ELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE API¥ SUPERVISOR
07/14/07 r Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT_J_G/28/07 43-041-30047 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
17 Drilling 5,320 178 16.50 10.8 Kaibab 14,500
WUB DATA
DATETTME | DEPTH WT Vis PV P GELS  |FILTRATE] CAKE/Z]  SOLIDS 'SAND Ph CHLORIDES SALT CALC ] LCM
V/14/7:30a 5220 10.4 34 8 11 6/8 13.0 I 2 3.00 tr 10.4 200,000 | 330,000 | 1650 0
BITDATA
[BIT] SIZE WFG. TNPE ] VADC SERIAL NO. JETS (113200 ™ GUT | FOOTAGE | HOURS ROP MTWFWE'B BULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B G
4 112.250( Securty| era2e0p | 517 719749 |24]{24]|24]|22 5054 266 26.50 10.0 Y | 0/110 | 35/45
#DIV/0!
#DIV/0!
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUNMPPST |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE{ GAL/STK SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH 5224
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 35
1 |National 10P130) 6.0 10 3.5 100 | 350 1 400
2 |National 10P130| 6.0 10 35 | 100 | 350 CONFIDENTIAL RE PORT 2 | 400
0 3
700 | 137 |iso-19d 2675 | 350 | oss | 1058 | T 20
I DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERACINFO |
IBOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY# I 9 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 1.50 12.250 NP Arapian 4,050 4,050 ss, sh, lime, anhd.  [ICo Man 435-979-2202
Vertitak motor w/ilter sul 38.91 9.500 np Mudlogger
X0, fs, 11 3/4' stabilizer 11.84 8.000 2.94 Toolpusher
Shock sub 9.93]  8.000 2.56 S D reas i Last BOP Test 7/5
6 - 8" DC /X0 sub 180.57 8.000 2.94 LAl 8 | 15 na Next BOP Test 8/4
10-61/2"DC 300.88]  6.500 2.75 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 7/15
Jar 32.64 6.500 2.75 GAS UNITS FROM To ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill 714
2- 61/2"DC 56.30 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra] 7/13
2- 5" HWDP 61.21]  5.000 3.19 Last Operate Blind R4 713
TOTAL 693.78 Last Operate Annular! 7114
[TSTRINGWT. | BRAWT. | PUWT, SOWT. ROT. TORQUE| GRD. ELEVATION | GL TOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 NT GASING 2 PROD CSG
162,000 | 74900 | 175000 | 150000 | o Y 5783 26 5,819 1,915 (7000) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD_ | INCL_| AZMUTH VD N+/S- ]| Es/W-_ |SECTION] DLS | TooL | _MD_] INCL AZIMUTH VD N+/S-_] E+/W- [SECTION] DLS ] _TOOL
| - - DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM | 10 VRS TAST 24 HOURS:

0:00 | 6:00 | 6.00

Drill & survey 5142' to 5224'

6:00 | 10.00]| 4.00

Mud line repair # 1 pump -- service rig -- top drive

10:00] 16:30 | 6.50

Drill & survey 5224' to 5263’

16:30] 20:00 | 3.50

Mud line repair # 1 pump -- held bop drill response time 2 min 27 sec. -- worked annular

20:00} 0:00 | 4.00

Drill & survey 5263' to 5320'

0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00

5358' Drilling @ 0500 hour

0:00

0:00

Daily Total 24.00




Engineering and Supervision EXACTE ngineering, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE WLL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
07/13/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
16 Drilling 5,142 208 16.00 13.0 Kaibab 14,500
WMUD DATA
_D-AWE DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRA?EII CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
/13/7:30an] 5050 10.4 34 7 10 6/8 124 2 3.00 tr 10.2 | 200,000 | 330,000 | 1800 | o©
BIT DATA
BIT] SIZE WFG. TYPE 1ADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd") ™ GUT | FOOTAGE ] HOURS FOP MIF] RPM | WOB | DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T 8 G
3112.250] Reed | Tpsa-a | 537 | LD6453 |28|28|28 4056 | 5054 | 998 42.00 23.8 ylon10| 2045 4fj2] i
4 112.250| Securty| erazeop | 517 | 719749 |24]|24f24|22 5054 88 10.00 8.8 Y [ 01110] 40150
#DIV/O!
#DIV/0l
HAYDRAULICS SLOWPUMP PST_|
PUMP | MANUFACTURER LNER | sTRoke| caL/sTk | sem | aem | avoe | avbc | pump | MoToRODIFF HHP/INZ ECD DEPTH | 5100
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 35
1 [National 10P130| 6.0 10 35 | 100 | 350 1 | 350
2 |National10P13] 60 | 10 | 35 |100] 30| CONFIDENTIAL REPORT [ 2 [ss0
3 0 3
) ol wsedeans] s | e | we | 777277777
| DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
IBOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY#I 9 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 1.50 12.250 NP Arapian 4,050 4,050 ss, sh, lime, anhd.  ||Co Man 435-979-2202
Vertitak motor wifilter sul 38.91 9.500 np Mudlogger
%0, fs, 11 3/4' stabilizer 11.84 8.000 2.94 Toolpusher
Shock sub 9.93] 8.000 256 | e e e Last BOP Test 7/5
6 - 8" DC / XO sub 180.57|  8.000 2.94 0 | s | 15 | na Next BOP Test 8/4
10 - 6 1/2" DC 300.88] 6.500 2.75 SHows Last Safety Meeting | 7/14
Jar 32.64]  6.500 2.75 GAS UNITS FROM 0 ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill 7/12
2-61/2"DC 56.30 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Raj 7/13
2 - 5" HWDP 6121}  5.000 3.19 Last Operate Blind R 7/13
TOTAL 693.78 Last Operate AnnularI 7/5
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUY| GRD. ELEVATION GLTOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
162,000 | 74900 | 175000 | 150000 | o § 5763 26 5,819 1,915 (7000) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL.. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+ /W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
| — _ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 6:00 | 6.00 Drill & survey 4930’ to 5054
6:00 | 10:00| 4.00 Trip out close blind rams
10:00} 14:00 | 4.00 Change bit clean filter screen open blind rams trip intc wobbel jt. Change corr ring trip in 2616’ fill pipe trip into
14:00] 0:00 | 10.00 Drill & survey 5054' to 5142"
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 5220 Drilling @ 0600 hour
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00




Engineering and Supervision EXACT E ng i neeri ng ) Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oll Co of Utah, LLC DAl LY DR".LING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE APE SUPERVISOR
07/12/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
15 Drifling 4,930 561 22.50 24.9 Kaibab 14,500
— MUD DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRATE[ CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
V/12/7:30an] 4545 10.4 32 5 9 5/8 n/c I 2 3.00 tr 9.5 200,000 | 330,000 | 1800 0
BIT DATA
[BIT] szt WFG. TVPE TADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd") N GUT | FOOTAGE | HOURS ROP MTR] RPM | WOB ] DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T| B G
3]12.250] Reed | 7D53-A 537 LD6453 |28]28]28 4056 874 36.00 24.3 Y ]0/110] 20/45
#DIV/Ol
#DIV/O1
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SLOW PUMP PST |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE | GAL/STK SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH 4170
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSl SPM 35
1 |National 10P130] 6.0 10 3.5 100 | 350 1 310
2 |National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 | 100 | 350 CONF/DENTIA[_ REPORT 2 | 310
3 0 3
i o | wlsedes] ws | e | wes |
I DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
IBOTTOM HOLE ASSEMELV#I 8 LENGTH O.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 1.50 12.250 NP Arapian 4,050 4,050 ss, sh, ime, anhd.  [ICo Man 435-979-2202
Vertitak motor w/filter sul 38.91 9.500 np “Mudlogger
x0, fs, 11 3/4' stabilizer 11.84 8.000 2.94 Toolpusher
Shock sub 9.93 8.000 2.56  |[EoTTOMSUP TME] B GAS | "’“é’é&& BAS T AP GAS Last BOP Test 7/5
6 - 8" DC / XO sub 180.57]  8.000 2.04 33 | 8 | 15 [ na Next BOP Test 8/4
10-61/2" DC 300.88 6.500 2.75 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 7/13
Jar 32.64 6.500 2.75 GAS UNITS FROM 7O ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill 7/12
2-61/2"DC 56.30 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra] 7/13
2 -5"HWDP 61.21 ’ 5.000 | 3.19 Last Operate Blind RJ 711
TOTAL 693780 Y Last Operate Annular] 7/5
[ STRING WT. BHA WT, PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUH| GRD. ELEVATION GLTOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
161,000 | 60,000 165,000 | 155000 | o0 [ 5793 26 5,819 1,915 (7000) {14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION| DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
| - - DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM T0 HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 14:30 | 14.50 Drill & survey 4369 to 4642'
14:30] 15:00] 0.50 Rig service
15:00{ 19:30 | 4.50 Drill & survey 4642' to 4781’
19:30] 20:30 | 1.00 Weld wash on standpipe manafold
20:30| 0:00 | 3.50 Drill & survey 4781' to 4930’
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 5045' Drilling @ 0505 hour.
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00




Engineering and Supervision EXACTE ng ineeri ng, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oll Co of Utah, LLC DA' LY DR'LL'NG REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE APTE SUPERVISOR
07/11/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
14 Drilling 4,369 319 14.00 22.8 Kaibab 14,500
MUD DATA
DATE/TIME DEFH WT vis PV YP GELS m CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
y/11/7:30an] 4056 10.4 33 8 10 7/9 e | 3 3.00 tr 9.8 200,000 | 330,000 | 1800| o
BIT DATA
[BiT] szt MFG. “TVPE TADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/aznd) ™ UT | FOOTAGE | TiOUTS ROP MTR] RPM | WOB ] DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B <]
2]12.250] RTC | wesia | 447 | HP5745 |28|28|28 1985 | 4056 | 2071 | 78.50 26.4 Y|o0/110]|20/45] 4] 2} 1/32°
3112.250] Reed | Toss-a | s37 | LD6453 |28]|28|28 4056 313 13.50 23.2 Y | 0/100] 30-45
#DIV/O!
#DIV/O!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMPPST |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE | GAL/STK SPM GPM AVDP | AVDC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH 4170
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSt SPM 65
1 |National 10P130| 6.0 10 35 100 | 350 1 250
2 [National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 100 | 350 CONFIDEN TIAL REPOR T 2 | 250
3 0 3
7% 700 | 137 [so10d ees0 | 325 | smes | 1065 |
| DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
IBOTTOM HOLE ASSEMELY#I 8 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 1.50] 12.250 NP Arapian 4,050 4,050 ss, sh, lime, anhd. _ [|Co Man 435-979-2202
Vertitak motor w/filter su 38.91 9.500 np Mudlogger
xo, fs, 11 3/4' stabilizer 11.84|  8.000 2.94 Toolpusher
Shock sub 9.93] 8.000 2.56 |[noTToMSUPTME] " BGTAS T mggﬁﬁm I TRIFGAS Last BOP Test 7/5
6 - 8" DG / XO sub 180.57|  8.000 2.94 33 | 8 | 15 na Next BOP Test 8/4
10 - 6 1/2" DC 300.88]  6.500 2.75 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 7/11
Jar 32.64] 6.500 2.75 GAS UNITS FROM 0 ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill
2- 61/2"DC 56.30]  6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra] 7/5
2 - 5" HWDP 61.21]  5.000 3.19 Last Operate Blind R4 7/11
TOTAL 693.78 Last Operate Annularl 7/5
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUH| GRD. ELEVATION GLTOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
155 60 160 145 | o I 5708 2 5,819 1,915 (7000) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVO N+/S- E+ /W- SECTION DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH VD N+/S- E+/W- } SECTION OLS TOOL
[ _ _ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | :30 | 0.50 Drill & survey 4050 TO 4056’
:30 | 1:00 | 0.50 Circ.
1:00 | 4:00 | 3.00 Trip out work blind rams
400 | 6:00 | 2.00 Clean screen float sub & change bits
6:00 | 8:00 | 2.00 Trip in pickup 6-6.5" drill collars
8:00 | 13:00| 5.00 Drill & survey 4056 to 4170’
13:00} 13:30 | 0.50 Service rig
13:30) 20:30 | 7.00 Drill & survey 4170 to 4339’
20:30{ 22:30 | 2.00 Circ. Work air out of mud 350 psi loss
22:30] 0:00 | 1.50 Drill & Survey 4339 to 4369’
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 4419 Drilling @ 0230 hour.
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




Engineering and Supervision EXACT E n g i neeri ng 3 I ncC. (918) 599-9400 office

Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oll Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE | SPUD DATE APW SUPERVISOR
07/10/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Darren Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
13 Drilting 4,050 485 22.00 22.0 Kaibab 14,500
WMUD DATA
[ DATETIME DEPTH WT vis PV P GELS _ |FILTRATE] CAKER2 ] SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC ] LM
y/10/7:30ant 3730 10.4 29 5 7 5/7 n/c l 2 3.25 tr 10.0 200,000 | 325,050 | 1850
BIT DATA
[BT] SZE | WrG. TVPE TDC | SERIAL NO. JETS (1732nd) ™ OUT | FOOTAGE | HOURS ROP WTF] APM | WOB |_DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T{8B G
512.250] RTC HP51A 447 HP5745 |28|28]|28 1985 2065 78.00 26.5 Y |]0/1101 20/45
#DIV/0!
#DIV/0!
#D1V/0!
HAYDRAULICS — SLOW PUMP PST |
PUMP | MANUFACTURER LUNER | sTrRoke| aaL/stk | sem | apm | avor | avoc | pump | moTOR DIFF HHP/INZ ECD DEPTH | 3500
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 65
1 [National 10P130| 6.0 10 3.5 110 | 385 1 250
2 |National 10P130] 6.0 10 | 35 | 110 385 CONFIDENTIAL REPORT 2 | 250
3 0 3
D ) o s leed e ew | mes | wes | U
DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
BOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY#I 7 LENGTH Q.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 1.50 12.250 NP Arapian 4,050 4,050 ss, sh, lime, anhd.  ||Co Man 435-979-2202
Vertitak motor w/filter suj 38.91 9.500 np Mudlogger
x0, fs, 11 3/4' stabilizer 11.84 8.000 2.94 Toolpusher
Shock sub 9.93] 8.000 2.56 sy - ——Tmrem—] Last BOP Test 7/5
6 - 8" DC / XO sub 180.57 8.000 2.94 32 8 I 15 I na Next BOP Test 8/4
4-61/2"DC 115.89]  6.500 2.75 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 7/10
Jar 32.64 6.500 2.75 GAS UNITS FROM TO ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill
2- 61/2"DC 56.30 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra} 7/5
2 - 5" HWDP 61.21 5.000 3.19 Last Operate Blind R4 7/5
TOTAL 50879 Last Operate Annularl 7/5
STRING WT. BHA WT, PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUE) GRD. ELEVATION GL TOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
142 55 150 | 137 | I 5793 26 5,819 1,915 (7000) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- Es+ / W- SECTION OLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
[ — — DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 1:30 | 1.50 Drill & survey 3565 to 3606
1:30 | 2:30 | 1.00 Work on #2 pump
2:30 { 13:00 ] 10.50 Drill & survey 3606 to 3890
13:00] 13:30 | 0.50 Rig service
13:30{ 0:00 | 1050 Drill & survey 3890 to 4050
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 This am TIH w/ new bit # 6
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00




Engineering and Supervision EXACT Eng i neeri ng ’ I ncC. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oll Co of Utah, LLC DA' LY DR“.L'NG REP ORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE APIR SUPERVISOR
07/09/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Darren Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
12 Drilling 3,565 573 21.50 26.7 Kaibab 14,500
_ MOD DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PY YP GELS FH.TRATE[ CAKE2 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
7/9/7:30am| 3209 10.4 29 4 9 5/7 n/c | 2 3.00 tr 10.0 197,000 | 325,050 | 2000
BIT DATA
[BT] St WFG. TYPE JADC SERIAL NO. JETS (aznd) N GUT | FOOTAGE | HOURS ROP MTR] RPM ] WOB | DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T|®8 G
4112.250] RTC HP51A 447 HP5745 |28]28]28 1915 | 1985 70 3.00 23.3 n| 60 25 |1{1 |
5]12.250] RTC | Hps1a | 447 | HP5745 [28|28]28 1985 1580 | 56.00 28.2 Y|o/110] 30
#DIV/O!
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SLOW PUMP PSI |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE | GAL/STK SPM GPM AVDP | AVDC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH 3600
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSt SPM 65
1 |National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 110 | 385 1 250
2 [Natiorat10p13d 60 | 10 | a5 | 10| CONFIDENTIAL REPORT [ 2 |25
3 0 3
770 | 143 Derzod 2000 | 200 | 7wes | 1065 | Y
BRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
'BOTI’OM HOLE ASSEMBLWOI 7 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD ™D LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 1.50] 12.250 NP Arapian Co Man 435-979-2202
Vertitak motor wifilter su 38.91 9.500 np Mudlogger
x0, fs, 11 3/4' stabilizer 11.84 8.000 2.94 Toolpusher
Shock sub 9.93 8.000 2.56 TAS ] G“"é’é‘%ﬁm I s Last BOP Test 7/5
6 - 8" DC / XO sub 180.57]  8.000 2.94 25 l 3 l 9 na Next BOP Test 8/4
4-61/2"DC 115.89]  6.500 2.75 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 7/9
Jar 32.64] 6500 2.75 GAS UNITS FROM o ROP (FTHR) Last BOP Drill
2- 61/2"DC 56.30]  6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Raj  7/5
2 - 5" HWDP 61.21]  5.000 3.19 Last Operate Blind R4 7/5
TOTAL 508.79 Last Operate Annularl 7/5
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUEI GRD. ELEVATION GL TOKB KB ELEVATION [SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 Pl C!
136 55 150 [ 130 5,793 26 5,819 1,915 (7000) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH VO N+/§- E+/W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
_ — _ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 16:00 | 16.00 Drill & survey 2992 to 3419
16:00| 16:30 | 0.50 Rig service
16:30| 18:00 ] 1.50 Drifl & survey 3419 to 3440
18:00| 18:30 | 0.50 Work on #2 pump
18:30| 21:30 | 3.00 Drill & survey 3440 to 3542
21:30] 23:00| 1.50 Work on #2 pump
23:00] 0:00 | 1.00 Drill & survey 3542 to 3565
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 note: revised kb elevation for skid system
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
~SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




Engineering and Supervision EXACTE ngineering, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oli Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE — [WeLL CONTRAGTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE APH SUPERVISOR.
07/08/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Darren Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
1 Drilling 2,992 424 13.50 31.4 Kaibab 14,500
WOD DATA
DATE/TIME [ﬁH wT VIS PV YP GELS F|LTRA4Ta CAKE/a2 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
7/8/7:30am 2807 10.4 32 5 10 7/9 n/c I 2 3.00 tr 10.0 195,000 | 321,750 | 2100
BITDATA
W’les MFG. | TYPE TADC | SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd") W] 0T | TOOTAGE | NOURS FIOF WTRl FPM ] WOB ] DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA AT+MTR T B G
4]112.250] RTC HPS1A 447 HP5745 |28|28]|28 1915 | 1985 70 3.00 23.3 n| 60 25 111 |
5]12.250{ RTC HP51A 447 HP5745 (28]|28]|28 1985 1007 34.50 29.2 Y{0/110] 30
#DIV/O!
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMPPSI |
PUMP | MANUFACTURER UNER | sTRokE| GaL/stk | sPm | apm | avor | avoc | pump |  MoTORDIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PS| SPM
1 [National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 110 | 385 1
2_|national1op13d 60 | 10 | 35 | 110]ass| CONFIDENTIAL REPORT [
3 0 3
. %7 170 | 143 [teemod 1950 200 | rseets] 1065 |
I DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
IBOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLVKI 7 LENGTH o.D. 1.0. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 1.50] 12.250 NP Arapiean Co Man 435-979-2202
Vertitak motor wfilter su 38.91 9.500 np Mudlogger
%0, fs, 11 1/2" stabilizer 11.84 8.000 2.94 Toolpusher
Shock sub 9.03]  8.000 2.56 L — — Last BOP Test 7/5
5 - 8" DC / XO sub 180.57]  8.000 2.94 2 | | | Next BOP Test 8/4
4-61/2"DC 115.89]  6.500 2.75 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 7/8
Jar 32.64 6.500 2.75 GAS UNITS FROM To ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill
2- 61/2"DC 56.30 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra} 7/5
2 - 5" HWDP 61.21 5.000 3.19 Last Operate Blind R4 7/5
TOTAL 508.79 Last Operate Annularl 7/5 |
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUY| GRD. ELEVATION GLTOKB KB ELEVATION ISURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
115 55 120 10 | | 5793 2 5818 | 1915 (7000) (14500)
SURVEYS
MOD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH VD N+/S- E+/W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
| — il DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:

0:00 ] 0:30 | 0.50

Repair mud line, discharge off pumps.

0:30 | 13:30 ] 13.00

Drill & survey 2568 to 2971

13:30] 23:30 | 10.00

Repair mud line, where mud line turns from sub up to floor. Replaced T union & 2' mud line.

23:30[ 0:00 | 0.50

Drill & survey 2971 to 2992

0.00

0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00

Have replaced all visible & most critical turns in mud line.

0:00

We are making preperations to replace entire mud line including stand pipe.

0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00

Daily Total 24.00




Engineering and Supervision

EXACT Engineering, Inc.

(918) 599-9400 office

Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

24 hrs - midnight to midnight

DATE TWELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
07/07/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Darren Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
10 Work on mudline 2,568 33 1.50 22.0 Kaibab 14,500
MUD BATA
ITE/'TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS m CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
7/7/08:00 | 2567 10.2 32 6 9 5/7 e | 2 1.75 tr 7.0 195,000 | 321,750 | 2100
— — — — _ BIT DATA _
BIT SIZE MFG. TYPE IADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd") IN ouT FOOTAEE Hm ROP MTI RPM WwoB DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T| 8 G
4|12.250] RTC | wesia | 447 | HP5745 |28}28|28 1915 [ 1985 | 70 3.00 233 n| 60 | 25 J1f{1 |
5112250} RTC | wpsia | 447 | HP5745 |[28|28|28 1985 583 | 21.00 27.8 vlonio| 30
#DIV/0!
#DIV/0l
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMP PST |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE | GAL/STK SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. [2:1] SPM
1 |National 10P130| 6.0 10 35 | 110 ] 385 1
2 |National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 | 110 ] 3ss CONFIDENTIAL REPORT 2
3 0 3
770 | 143 |1eeio04 1950 | 200 | 7seera | 1043 | )
DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
BOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLV’!I 7 LENGTH O.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 150] 12.250 NP Arapiean Co Man 435-979-2202
Vertitak motor wifilter su 38.91 9.500 np Mudlogger
x0, fs, 11 1/2' stabilizer 11.84]  8.000 2.94 Toolpusher
Shock sub 993 8.000 256 _|Imorronsor e sem T oo ——Trms—] Last BOP Test 7/5
6 - 8" DC / XO sub 180.57]  8.000 2.94 2 | | Next BOP Test 8/4
4-61/2"DC 115.89]  6.500 2.75 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 7/7
Jar 3264] 6500 275 GAS UNITS FROM 7o ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill
2- 61/2"DC 56.30]  6.500 275 Last Operate Pipe Ral 7/5
2 - 5" HWDP 61.21]  5.000 3.19 Last Operate Blind R4 7/5
TOTAL 508790 /i Last Operate Annular] _7/5
[~ STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUY| GRD. ELEVATION GL TOKB KB ELEVATION [SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 ROD CSG
110 55 112 | 108 | | 5703 26 5,818 1,915 (7000) {14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- £+/W- |SECTION} DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- | SECTION] DLS TOOL
[ _ _ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 1:30 | 1.50 Drill & survey 2535 to 2566
1:30 | 0:00 | 22.50 Repair Mud line both pumps.
0:00 | 0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 This am drilling @ 2800
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00




Englineering and Supervision EXACT Eng i neeri ng y I nc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Ol Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWELL CONTRAGTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE APIK SUPERVISOR
07/06/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Darren Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
9 Dirilling 2,535 550 19.50 28.2 Kaibab 14,500
- WMUD BATA
DATE/TME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS F|LTFMTE[ CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
7/6/08:00 2038 10.1+ 29 2 3 2/3 n/c I 2 1.00 tr 7.4 196,000 | 324,000 | 2200
BIT DATA
[BIT] SIZE | MFG. TYPE TADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd) ™ SUT | FOOTAGE | FoURS ROP MTR| RPM | WOB ] DULL CONDITION |
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T] 8B G
4 ]112.250] RTC HP51A 447 HP5745 }28]|28]28 1915} 1985 70 3.00 23.3 n|] 60 25 1]1 |
5 |12.250] RTC HP51A 447 HP5745 |28]28[28 1985 550 19.50 28.2 Y{0/110] 30
#DIV/0!
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMPPST |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE | GAL/STK SPM GPM AVDP | AVDC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM
1 |National 10P130{ 6.0 10 3.5 110 | 385 1
2 |national10P13d_60 | 10 | 35 | 110 3ss | CONFIDENTIAL REPORT | z
3 0 3
] 10| v fweeod ]| 20 [mesu] was |
| DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
[BOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY#] 6 LENGTH Q.D. 1.0. FORMATION MD TVD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 1.50 12.250 NP Arapiean Co Man 435-979-2202
Vertitak motor w/filter sul 38.91 9.500 np Mudlogger
xo, fs, 11 1/2' stabilizer 11.84 8.000 2.94 Toolpusher
68" DC / XO sub 18057] _ 8.000 2.94_|[morrowsur TR T T oo — TP Last BOP Test 7/5
4-61/2"DC 115.89]  6.500 2.75 | [ Next BOP Test 8/4
Jar 32.64] 6.500 2.75 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 7/6
2-61/2"DC 56.30 6.500 2.75 GAS UNITS FROM TO ROP (FTHR) Last BOP Drill
2 - 5" HWDP 61.21 5.000 3.19 Last Operate Pipe Ra] 7/5
Last Operate Blind R{ 7/5
TOTAL Last Operate Annular] 7/5
STRING WT. BAAWT. BUWY. ROT. TORQUE]| GRD. ELEVATION | GLTOKB | KB ELEVATION |SURF GSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG |
110 55 112 | 108 | [ 5703 26 5,818 1,915 (7000) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- |SECTION] OLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH VD N+/S- E+/W- | SECTION] DLS TOOL
[ _ _ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 3:30 | 3.50 PU Vertitak
3:30 | 4:30 1.00 TIH
4:30 | 0:00 | 19.50 Drill & survey 1985 to 2535
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0.00
0:.00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




Engineering and Supervision EXACT E ng i neeri ng ) I ncC. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC DAI LY DR“.L'NG REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWELL CONTRAGTOR COUNTY, STATE | SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
07/05/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Darren Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
8 Trip to PU vertitrak 1,985 70 3.00 23.3 Kaibab 14,500
_ MUD DATA _
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRATE[ CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
7/5/08:00 1915 10.2 34 6 7 4/6 we | 2 1.50 0 6.8 200,000 | 330,000 | 2450
BITDATA
[BIT] szt MFG. TYPE TADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd") ) GUT | FOOTAGE | HOURS ROP MTR| FFM ] WOB ] DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T] B G
4 [12.250] RTC | wes1a | 447 | HP5745 |28|28|28 1915 | 1985 70 3.00 23.3 n| 60 | 25
#DIV/O!
#DIV/O!
#DIV/O!
HYDRAULICS ~ SLOWPUMPPSI |
PUMP | MANUFACTURER LUNER | sTROKE| @AL/sTk | spm | apm | avoe | avoc | pume MOTOR DIFF HHP/INZ EGD DEPTH
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI 10.9 SPM
1 [National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 100 | 350 1
2 [National 10P130| 6.0 10 3.5 100 | 350 CONFIDENT/AL REPORT 2
3 0 3
700 | &1 fes1| oo | I [ | ¥
| DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
lBOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLWI 5 LENGTH 0.D. +D. FORMATION MD ™D LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 1.50] 12.250 NP Arapiean Co Man 435-979-2202
Bit sub 3.01 8.000 np Mudlogger
6-8"DC 177.52 8.000 2.94 Toolpusher
X0 3.09] 7.500 2.88 [EOTIONSUPTME] —BEGAS | Gmgén T TAPCAS |l Last BOP Test 7/5
6-61/2°DC 174.19]  6.563 2.75 | | Next BOP Test 8/4
2 - 5" HWDP 61.21]  5.000 3.19 SHows Last Safety Meeting | 7/5
GAS UNITS FROM TO ROP {FT/HR} Last Bop Drill
Last Operate Pipe Raj 7/5
Last Operate Blind R4 7/5
TOTAL 420.52 Last Operate Annularl 7/5
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUEt GRD. ELEVATION |  GL TOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
100 50 102 98 | 700 | 5793 2 5,818 (1915) (7000) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N4+/S- E+/W- { SECTION DLS TOOL
[ _ _ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 5:00 | 5.00 NU BOPE
5:00 Test blind rams-both sets 5" pipe rams-choke manafold-super choke-adjustable choke-hcr valve-choke line
0:00 Manual choke line valve-kill line valve-check valve-floor safety valve-top drive valve
0:00 all tested @ 200 psi for 5 min. & 5000 psi for 10 min. all tested good
0:00 Test annular to 2500 psi for 10 min.-tested 13-3/8" casing to 1500 psi for 30 min.-both held good
0:00 | 12:00 ] 7.00 Tested accumulator & accumulater bottels had 1025-1150 psi on precharge both good
12:00] 16:00 | 4.00 Re fab spool between annular & rotating head, refab flow line to fit with skid system.
16:00| 18:00 [ 2.00 PU new bit #3 TIH tag @ 1870
18:00| 19:00 | 1.00 Drill cement & shoe.
19:00] 19:30 | 0.50 Drill 10' new hole, formation integrity test to 10.5 ppg. EMW.
19:30] 22:30 | 3.00 Drill 1925 to 1985
22:30] 0:00 | 1.50 POOH to PU vertitrak system.
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 This am drilling @ 2100
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FTOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




.

Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
April 2004 0040137
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR i Mareh 312007
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT +Tome Serl No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-73528
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian. Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. N/A
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side. 7. IfUnit or CA/Agreemen. Name and/or No
" Wolverine Fed Exploration Unit
. Typeof Well |
Oil Well [C] Gas Well ] Orher % Well Name and No
. Wolverine Federal 17-8
2
2. Name of Operator Wolverine Gas & Oil Company of Utah, LLC 5 APl Well No.
3a  Address 3b. Phone No. finclude area code) 4304130047
One Riverfront Plaza, 55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, Ml 616-458-1150 10. Field and Pool. or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R.. M., or Survey Description) Covenant Field
Surface hole location - 2020' FSL & 1610' FWL, NE/4 SW/4 Section 17, T23, RIW 1. County or Parish. State
Bottom hole location - 2020' FSL & 1610' FWL, NE/4 SW/4 Section 17, T23S, R1W Sevier Co. UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
I:l Acidize D Deepen D Production (Start/Resume) DWaler Shut-Off
Notice of [ntent Alter Casing [ Fracture Treat [ Rectamation Edwen Integrity
] Subsequent Report ] Casing Repair [ New Construction CJ Recomplete Cother
D y . Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon
Final Abandonment Notice D Convert to Injection D Plug Back L—_] Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally. give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation. have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Given: APD provides for 9-5/8" intermediate casing set depth of 10,600

Request: Alter intermediate casing set depth from 10,600' to approx 7000’ to protect prospective Navajo Sand from potentially damaging drill
fluids while drilling below 7000°.

Plan: Run 9-5/8" 47ppf HCP-110 LTC (same wt & grd as present APD) from drilled TD of approx 7000' to surface with stage tool placed at
approx 5600'. Raise cement from TD to approx S600' in stage 1 using 550 sx 50/50 POZ (25% excess, 14.3ppg, 1.28 cfps) and from 5600 to 1000’
in stage 2 using 180 sx CBM Light 111 (25% excess, 10.5 ppg, 4.29 c¢fps) and 790 sx Premium (25% excess, 15.8ppg, 1.29 cfps). Drill 8-1/2" hole
from approx 7000' to a projected total depth of 14,500' and run a.5-1/2" casing liner.

. .,
Expect open-hole logging operations July 22 and casing and cementing operations July 23, 2007. { ;
L OPYSENT
3 Pitevic M

xc: UDOGM P Iniliols

g

e

14, 1 hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Steven R Hash I Title Consuiting Engineer - EXACT Engineering Inc¢

Signature % TZ . M Date 07/20/2007

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STAMCORABEUSE. 1
ptatrDivisioh-S

nil, Gas and m &

Approvedby _ _ o e o e e _ Titl
Conditions of approval. if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease == offiae - .
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. <

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make ita crime forany person knowingly Mfull} tomake to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to apargalterwithin its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2) nmeECoIveED

wezsaw  CONFDENTIAL

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING




EXACT Engineering, Inc. www.exactengineering.com

415 S. Boston Ave., Suite 734, Tulsa, OK 74103 « (918) 599-9400 e« (918) 599-9401 (fax)

Steven R. Hash, P.E.
Registered Professional Engineer
stevehash@exactengineering.com

July 30, 2007

Mr. Al McKee

Bureau of Land Management
Utah State Office

P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

Y Mr. Dustin Doucet
Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Sait Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Re: Drilling Update #3 - Wolverine Federal 17-8
Sec 17 T23S RO1W
Sevier Co, UT
API# 43-041-30047

Gentlemen,
On behalf of Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC, please find enclosed daily drilling reports for the
subject well from July 20, 2007 through July 30, 2007. We set and cemented 9-5/8” casing at 6985 feet on July

26, 2007 and are presently drilling 8-1/2” hole at 7849 feet. Our Sundry Report of 9-5/8" Casing and Cementing
operations is enclosed. We res| ectfully request that the enclosed information remain confidential.

Sincerely, (7 ]

Steven R. Hash, P.E.

Enclosures

copy without enclosures via email to:
Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC:  Helene Bardolph
EXACT Engineering, Inc. well file

Petroleum Engineering Consulting, Personnel & Jobsite Supervision
complete well design, construction & management, drilling, completion, production, pipelines, appraisals,
due diligence, acquisitions, procedures, temporary personnel and field supervision




Engineering and Supervision EXACTE ngi neeri ng, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC DA' LY DR"..L' NG REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
[OATE TWELL CONTRAGTOR COUNTY, STATE . ] SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
07/20/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT l 6/28/07 43-041-30047 DL Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
23 Drilling 6,557 85 7.50 11.3 Kaibab 14,500
_ — MOD DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRATE} CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
p/20/7:30an] 6520 10.7 39 13 10 8/12 8.0 2 5.00 tr 10.0 200,000 | 330,000 | 1650 | o
BITDATA
[6T] szE | WrG. TVPE TADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32na") N SOT T TOOTRCE T TIOURS ROP MIF] RPM ] WOB T DULL CONDTION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T 8 G
6 {12.250| Reed |ma240roH| 537 | WP6106 |[28|28|28 5469 ] 6125 | 597 41.50 14.4 Yloniojass-45{8|E| |
7 [12.250] Smith [rs7onces| 647 | PC3896 |28|28]| 28|28 6125] 6520 | 395 32.00 12.3 v|on10}3s-50|6]E] |
8 [12.250| Smith | revoocr | 647v | PD2641 |28|28| 28|28 6520 37 3.50 10.6 Y j0/110} 38-50
#DIV/O!
HYDRAULICS SLOW PUMP P3I
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE| GAL/STK | SPM GPM | AvDP | AvDC | PumP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH | 6510
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 35
1 |National 10P130| 6.0 10 35 90 | 315 1 | 420
2 |NationaltoPiad 60 | 10 | 35 | s0 | 315s| CONFIDENTIAL REPORT [ 2 | o
3 0 3
630 | 123 [14317d 2800 | 250 | o022 | 1085 |
L BRILCSTAING "GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
IBOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY#' 12 LENGTH 0D. 1.D. FORMATION MD VO LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 1.50] 12.250 NP Arapian 4,050 4,050 ss, sh, lims, anhd.  [ICo Man 435-979-2202
Vertitak motor wifilter su 38.63 9.500 np Twin Creek | 5,611 5,611 Mudlogger
x0, fs, 11 3/4' stabilizer 11.84 8.000 2.94 Navajio 5,901 5,901 sS [Toolpusher
Shock sub 993 8.000 2.56 e [—TAPoa—| Last BOP Test 7/5
6 - 8" DC / XO sub 180.57|  8.000 2.94 56.5 ' 25 na Next BOP Test 8/4
10-61/2"DC 300.88]  6.500 275 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 7/20
Jar 32.64] 6.500 2.75 GAS UNITS FROM 0 ROP (FTHR) Last BOP Drill 7/20
2- 61/2"DC 58.30]  6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra| 7/20
2 - 5" HWDP 61.21 5.000 3.19 Last Operate Blind R4 7/20
TOTAL 695.50 %////////////ﬂ%/////% Last Operate Annular| 7/20
STRING WT. BHA WT. FUWT, O WT. ROT. TORQUE]| GRD. ELEVATION | GLTOKB | KB ELEVATION JSURF CSG | [ NG 1 [TNTCASING2 | PRODCSG |
202 74,900 214 | 198 | o | s7es 28 5819 | 1915 (7000) {14500)
— SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION| DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- | SECTION] DiS TOOL
[ — DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 4:00 | 4.00 Drill & survey 6472 to 6520, ROP slowed to 5' hr. differitial increased 100 psi.
4:00 | 6:00 | 2.00 Circ. Close pads on vertitrak, pump pill
6:00 [ 7:00 { 1.00 POOH to 4900
7:00 | 7:30 | 050 Rig Service, change slip dies
7:30 | 9:30 | 2.00 POOH close blind rams
9:30 | 11:00| 1.50 Change bit, check vertitrak, clean filtersub, operate pipe & blind rams, funtion test annular
11:00] 15:00 | 4.00 TIH to 5900 took 30k down wt. 50k overpull, pooh to 5800
15:00| 20:30 | 5.50 W&R 5800 to btm. Taking 2-5 wt. & torque @ 800-1100 psi
20:30| 0:00 | 3.50 Drill & survey 6520 to 6557
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 Hole took 80 bbls. While washing to btm. & is taking 15 bbl/hr.
0:00 pumping 15 ppbl. Calcium carbinate 80 bbl sweeps
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 06:00 drilling @ 6630
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
" SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FON ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




Engineering and Supervision EXACT Engineering, Inc- (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE Twell CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE ls'Pu"o' DATE AP SUPERVISOR |
07/21/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SS_;F #68 Sevier, UT 6/28/07 43-041-30047 DL Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
24 Drilling 6,845 288 23.50 12.3 Kaibab 14,500
[ — mq_ DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FlLTRATEI CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
f/21/7:30an] 6652 10.7 39 13 10 8/12 80 | 2 5.50 tr 10.2 | 200,000 | 330,000 | 1650| ©
BIT DATA
[BT] SZE | MFG. TVPE TADC SERIAL NO. JETS (173200 134 ST ] TO0TAGE T HouUnS ROP VTR ReM ] WoB ] DULL CORDITON |
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B G
6 {12.250] Reed |m4z49ron] 537 | WP6106 |28]28|28 5469 | 6125 | 597 41.50 14.4 v|on10]3s45] 8| E|
7 {12.250] Smith |re7o0ces| 647 | PC3896 |28|28]28|28 6125 | 6520 | 395 32.00 12.3 y{on10]38-50] 6| E|
8 112.250| Smith | re7oncr | 647y | PD2641 |28|28|28|28 6520 288 23.50 12.3 Y |0/110] 38-50
#DIV/O!
HYDRAULICS SCOWPUMP PST |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE | GAL/STK SPM GPM AVDP AVDC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH 6510
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 35
1 |National 10P130{ 6.0 10 3.5 80 | 280 1 | 420
2 |National10P130]_60 | 10 | 35 | 80 | 280 | CONFIDENTIAL REPORT [ 2 [ 4
3 0 3
i) 560 | 1o fisunodoson]| 200 | o [ 1062 | D
BRILC STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
BOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY#I 1 2 LENGTH 0.D. 1D, FORMATION MD TVD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 1.50 12.250 NP Arapian 4,050 4,050 ss, sh, ime, anhd.  [iCo Man 435-979-2202
Vertitak motor w/filter su| 38.63 9.500 np Twin Creek | 5,611 5,611 Mudlogger
x0, fs, 11 3/4' stabilizer 11.84 8.000 2.94 Navajio 5,901 5,901 sS Toolpusher
Shock sub 9.93] 8.000 2.56 T S o Last BOP Test 7/5
6 - 8" DC / XO sub 180.57]  8.000 2.94 76.8 37| 40 i na Next BOP Test 8/4
10- 6 1/2" DC 300.88]  6.500 2.75 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 7/21
Jar 32.64] 6.500 2.75 GAS UNITS FROM o ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill 7/20
2- 61/2'DC 58.30]  6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ral 7/20
2 - 5" HWDP 61.21]  5.000 3.19 Last Operate Blind R 7/20
205 74,900 26 5819 | 1915 (7000) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+ /W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
[ — DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 20:30 | 20.50 Drill & survey 6557 to 6797
20:30] 21:00 | 0.50 Rig service,clean out flow line
21:00] 0:00 | 3.00 Drill &survey 6797 to 6845
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 Pumped 4, 80 bbl! calcium carbide pills 15 ppbl. 4 hrs. apart, losing 15 bblhr. losses now minimal 2-3 bbihr.
0:00 last 24 hrs lost 210 bbl.
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 06:00 drilling @ 6954
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE CO5TS




Engineering and Supervision EXACT Eng i neeri ng 3 Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC DA".Y DR“.L' NG REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
[DATE TWELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE APIE 'SUPERVISOR
07/22/07 Wolvering Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 DL Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TO FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
25 Circ. & condition for logs 7,003 158 9.50 16.6 Kaibab 14,500
MUD DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV P GELS _ |FILTRATE] GAKE2] _ SOLIDS SAND PR CHLORIDES SALT CALC ] LCM
p/22/7:30an] 6966 10.7 41 13 12 o3 | 70 2 5.25 1 10.4 200,000 | 330,000 | 1650 | ©
BIT DATA
[BIT] SiZE | MFG. TYPE TADC | SERIAL NO. JETS (1732nd") L ST | TO0TAGE [ ROUnS ROP MR RPM ] WOB | DULL CONDITON |
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR 7|8 G
6 [12.250] Reed |ms24sPon| 537 | wPe106 |28|28|28 5469 | 6125 | 597 41.50 144 v|oni1o]ss45i 8] E] |
7 [12.250] Smith |rs7oncPs| 647 | PC3896 |28{28|28|28 6125 ] 6520 | 395 32.00 12.3 Y|lonio]3s-s0f6|E] 1
8 [12.250] Smith | re7oncR | 647v | PD2641 |28|28| 28|28 6520 | 7003 | 483 33.00 14.6 Ylonio]ss-s0§6|E] o
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMP PST |
PUMP | MANUFACTURER UNER | STROKE| GAL/STK | sPM GPM | AVDP | AVvDC | PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH | 6510
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PsI SPM |- 35
1 [National 10P130| 6.0 10 3.5 80 | 280 1 420
2 |National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 80 | 280 CONFI DEN TIA L R E POR T 2 | 420
3 0 3
560 | 109 |isoned 2300{ 150 | o01s | 1085 | o
BRILL STRING. GEOLOGIC GENERALIRFO |
[BOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLVOI 13 LENGTH 0.0. 1D, FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 1.50] 12.250 NP Arapian 4,050 4,050 ss, sh, lime, anhd.  {Co Man 435-979-2202
Bit sub 2.98 7.875 2.94 Twin Creek } 5,611 5,611 Mudlogger
6-8" DC 177.48]  8.000 2.94 Navajio 5,901 5,901 55,90%,anhd.10%  [[Toolpusher
XO sub 3.09 8.000 2.94 T % T TraAs i Last BOP Test 7/5
75.7 30 38 44 Next BOP Test 8/4
10-61/2"DC 300.88]  6.500 2.75 SHOWS Last Safety Mesting | 7/22
Jar 32.64| 6.500 275 GAS UNITS FROM TO ROP (FTHR) Last BOP Drill 7/22
2- 61/2"DC 58.30 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra] 7/22
2 - 5" HWDP 61.21 000 3.19 Last Operate Blind R{ _7/22
TOTAL ] Laws?t_gg%r_ate Annular] 7/22
STRING WT. BHA WT. X GLTOKB | KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG TNT CASING 1 T NG 2 PRI
200 67 290 | 195 | o [ 5793 26 5819 | 1915 (7000) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH VD N+/S- E+/W- |SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- | SECTION{ OLS TOOL.
[ — DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 9:30 | 9.50 Drill & survey 6845 to 7003, losses minimal 2-3 bblhr. ROP went from 5.9'hr @ 6999 to 14.4'hr @ 7003 where]
9:30 | 11:00 Lost 100% returns. Spot 50 bbl. 6ppbl. Ancosorb (diametric polemer) pill on btm. Had 0 returns until 80 % of
11:00] 11:00{ 1.50 displacement gone, then appr. 50% returns, pumping @ reduced rate of 8.33 bpm.
11:00] 12:00 | 1.00 POOH to 5900, hole drag normal.
12:00§ 12:30 | 0.50 Circ. Clear pipe 90% returns, fluid level fell 30" after pumps stopped.
12:30| 15:00 | 2.50 POOH . Hole took 15 bbl. More than calculated fill volume.( 71 bbl )
15:00| 18:00 | 3.00 LD vertitrak, filter sub, stabilizer & float sub. Hole stayed full.
18:00| 19:00 | 1.00 Make up bit & bit sub w/float, TiH to shoe.
19:00 | 20:30 | 1.50 Slip & cut 150" drig line.
20:30| 0:00 | 3.50 TIH breaking circ. Every 2000' TIH to 6990 took 10k wt. pull up to 6960 circ. 100% returns no losses
0:00 Circ. w/ full rate (17.8 bpm) no losses.
0:00
0:00 Lost a total of 360 bbl. Last 24 hrs. 315 bbls. While pumping & displacing LCM.
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 07:00 logging truck on location RU loggers.
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
—SEE ATTACHED COSTDETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




Engineering and Supervision EXACT Eng i neeri ng 3 Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverlne Gas & Oll Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
[DATE TWELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE | SPUD DATE APIE SUPERVISOR
07/23/07 Woiverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT I 6/28/07 43-041-30047 DL Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
26 Logging 7,003 0 0.00 #DIV/0! Kaibab 14,500
[ MUD DATA _
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRA CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
y/23/8:45a 7003 10.7 42 13 13 9/13 7.0 | 2 5.25 0.50 10.2 200,000 | 330,000 | 1650 0
BIT DATA
[BT] Sz | WrG. VPE TADC | SERIAL NO. ~JETS (173200 ™ (L e Y ~=RoP VI e ] wWoB T DU conoron ]
NO. CODE or TFA RAT+MTR T B G
6 | 12.250{ Reed |M42a9POH| 537 WP6106 |28{28|28 5469 | 6125 597 41.50 14.4 Y|]0/110] 3845} 8| E |
7 112.250] Smith [re7oDCPS| 647 PC3896 |28]28[28|28 6125 | 6520 395 32.00 12.3 Y{0/110]38-50| 6 | E |
8 [12.250| Smith | F670DCR | 647Y PD2641 |28]|28]28|28 6520 | 7003 483 33.00 14.6 Y]0/110]38-50| 6 | E |
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMP PSI |
PUMP MANUFACTURER UINER | STROKE| GAL/STK | SPM GPM | Avor | avoc | pump MOTOR DIFF HHPAIN2 ECD DEPTH | 6510
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 35
1 |National 10P130 6.0 10 3.5 0 0 1 420
2 |National 10P130 60 | 10 | 35 o | CONFIDENTIAL REPORT [ =2 o
3 0 3
o foJofof o [ oo | 000 | D
DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
[BOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLV#I 13 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 1.50 12.250 NP Arapian 4,050 4,050 ss, sh, lime, anhd.  [ICo Man 435-979-2202
Bit sub 2.98 7.875 2.94 Twin Creek | 5,611 5,611 Mudlogger
6-8" DC 177.48 8.000 2.94 Navajio 5,901 5,901 55,90%,anhd.10%  [[Toolpusher
XO sub 300 8.000 2.94 RELEELYS TS Last BOP Test 7/5
75.7 30 | 38 | 44 Next BOP Test 8/4
10-6 1/2"DC 300.88 6.500 2.75 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 7/23
Jar 32.64 6.500 2.75 GAS UNITS FROM To ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill 7/22
2- 61/2"DC 58.30 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra] 7/22
2 - 5" HWDP 61.21 5.000 3.19 Last Operate Blind R4 7/22
TOTAL 638.08 Last Operate Annular| 7/22
[STRINGWT. | BRAWT. | PUWT. SOWT. . GRD. ELEVATION | GLTOKB | KB ELEVATION [SURFCSG ] INTCAGING 1 TNT CASING 2 PROD CSG
200 67 210 195 0o || s7es 26 5,819 1915 (7000) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- [SECTI DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- £+ /W- | SECTION| DLS TOOL
| _ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 1:30 | 150 Circ. & condition for logs, Circulate w/ full rate 17.8 bpm no losses
1:30 | 5:00 | 3.50 POOH for logs
5:00 | 7:00 | 2.00 WO loggers
7:00 | 0:00 | 17.00 Loggers arrived @ 7am. Rig up same & log
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 Drillers TD 7003 Loggers TD 7007
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 6am still logging
0:00
0:00
Dalily Total 24.00
SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COBTS




Engineering and Supervision

EXACT Engineering, Inc.

(918) 599-9400 office

Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

24 hrs - midnight to midnight

prom—
DATE

TWELL

—
CONTRACTOR

COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE PR 'SUPERVISOR
07/24/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 DL Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
27 Rig up casing crew 7,003 0 0.00 #DIV/0! Kaibab 14,500
[ — MUD BATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FR.YRATE] CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
p/24/8:45an] 7003 10.6+ 39 11 10 8/12 7.0 2 5.00 tr 10.2 200,000 | 330,000 | 1650] ©
BIT DATA
[BIT] Sizf | MFG. TNPE | IADC | SERIALNO. JETS (152nd") ™ SUT=T FOSTRSE T FOURS OP WTR RPM ] WOB |_DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B8 G
#DIV/O!}
#DIV/0}
#DIV/0!
#DIV/O!
HYBDRAULICS SLOWPUMP PSI |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE| GAL/STK | sPMm GPM | Avop | avDC | Pump MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH | 6510
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 35
1 [National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 80 | 280 1 420
2 |National 10P130| 6.0 10 35 80 | 280 CONFIDENTIAL REPORT 2 | 420
3 0 3
207 ] 50 | o hswed a0 | o | o | vom | 77477 A
DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
[BOTTOM HOLE WI 1 3 LENGTH 0.0. LD, FORMATION MD TVD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 1.50] 12.250 NP Arapian 4,050 4,050 ss, sh, lime, anhd. _[lCo Man 435-979-2202
Bit sub 298| 7.875 294 |l TwinCreek | 5,611 5,611 [IMudiogger
6-8" DC 177.48]  8.000 2.94 Navajio 5,901 5,901 $5,90%,anhd.10%  [[Toolpusher
XO sub 3.08] 8000 204 | SN ——rme— Last BOP Test 75
75.7 30 | 38 44 Next BOP Test 8/4
10-61/2"DC 300.88]  6.500 2.75 SHows Last Safety Meeting | 7/24
Jar 32,64] 6.500 2.75 GAS UNITS FROM ™ ROP (FTHR) Last BOP Drill 7/22
2- 61/2"DC 58.30]  6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra| 7/22
2 - 5" HWDP Last Operate Blind R4 7/22
TOTAL Last Operate Annular! 7/22
[STRING W1. BHA WT. [T GLToRE | ELEVATION JSURF CSG NT CASING 1 WT?,%gﬂEA NG 2
200 67 26 5819 I 1,915 (7000) {14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- | SECTION OLS TOOL
[ _ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 7:30 | 7.50 Logging, hole took 5 bbl.
7:30 | 9:00 [ 1.50 Pull wear bushing
9:00 | 13:30 | 4.50 TIH break circ. Every 2000', no losses
13:30| 15:00 | 1.50 Circ. & condition to run csng, hole took 30 bbl mud
15:00 | 15:30 { 0.50 spot 50 bbl. 25ppbl. LCM pill. 10 cedarfiber, 10 mica, 10 med nutplug.
15:30] 18:30 | 3.00 POOH to 8" DC'S
18:30| 21:00 | 2.50 LD 8" DC'S
21:00| 0:00 | 3.00 RU cacing & LD crews
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 6am running casing
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00




EXACT Engineering, Inc.

Engineering and Supervision (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC DAI LY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
07/25/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 DL Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
28 Circ. For 2nd stage 7,003 0 0.00 #DIV/0! Kaibab 14,500
— WMUD BATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRA’ CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
y/25/8:45an] 7003 10.6+ 39 11 10 8/12 7.0 I 2 5.00 tr 10.2 200,000 | 330,000 | 1650 0
BITDATA
w"_SIZE_'_MF-Gr TVPE 1ADC SERIAL NO. m ouT TOOTACE ] TOURS ROP M RPM WOB DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T 8 G
#DIV/0!
#DIV/0|
#DiV/0!
#DIV/0|
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMP PST |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE| GAL/STX SPM GPM AVDP | AVDC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH 6510
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 35
1 [National 10P130{ 6.0 10 3.5 80 | 280 1 420
2 |National 10P130f 6.0 10 35 80 | 280 CONFIDEN T/AL RE POR T 2 | 420
3 0 3
560 | 109 |15012d 2300 | o | o1 | 1078 |
DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC — GENERALINFO |
[BOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLYCI 1 3 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
bit 1.50 12.250 NP Arapian 4,050 4,050 ss, sh, lime, anhd.  [|Co Man 435-979-2202
Bit sub 2.98 7.875 2.94 Twin Creek { 5,611 5,611 Mudlogger
6-8" DC 177.48 8.000 2.94 Navajio 5,901 5,901 $5,80%,anhd.10%  [{Toolpusher
XO sub 3.09 8.000 2.94 T e T TRPGAS | Last BOP Test 7/5
75.7 30 l 38 44 Next BOP Test 8/4
10 -6 1/2" DC 300.88 6.500 2.75 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 7/25
Jar 32.64 6.500 2.75 GAS UNITS FROM T0 ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill 7/22
2- 61/2"DC 58.30 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra] 7/22
2 - 5" HWDP 61.21 5.000 3.19 Last Operate Blind R4 7/22
TOTAL 638.08 Last Operate Annular] 7/22
[STRINGWT. | __BRAWT, | W SO ROT. TO GRD. ELEVATION | _GLTOKS | KB ELEVATION JSURF GSG ] [ TNG 1 Wc_agiw_ﬁ'ﬁm—
325 340 300 0 5,793 26 5819 | 1915 (7000) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- |SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- | SECTION] DLS TOOL
[ — — DAILY ACTVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 15:00 | 15.00 PU & run 164 jts. 9 5/8, 47# P110, LTC intermidiate csng.set @ 6985'
15:00 17:30 | 2.50 RU cementers
17:30] 20:30 { 3.00 Cement 1st. Stage. Bump plug 2700 psi. @ 20:35, floats held, 100% (305,000) string wt. landed in MBS.
20:30| 21:30 | 1.00 Dropped bomb, open stage tool.
21:30| 0:00 | 2.50 Circ. w/ rig pump @ 6 bblpm
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 Detailed cement & csng report to follow
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 6 am circ. While WOC
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00




Engineering and Supervision EXACT E ng i nee ri ng ’ I ncC. (918) 599-9400 office

Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oll Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
[DATE TWELL CONTRAGTOR COUNTY, STATE | SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
07/26/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT l 6/28/07 43-041-30047 DL Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP YD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
29 TIH 7,003 0 0.00 #DIV/0! Kaibab 14,500
WMUD DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV P GELS _ |FILTRATE] CAKEG2] _SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC | LCM
/26/8:45an] 7003 10.5 37 11 10 82 | 70| 2 5.00 tr 10.2 | 200,000 | 330,000 [ 1650 o
BITDATA
[BIT] SIZE | MFG. TYPE TADC | SERIAL NO. JETS (1732nd") 1 SO 1 TO0TACE | TouRS. ROP WMIF] RPM ] WOB ] DULL CONDITION |
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B G
9| 8.500| RTC | 1D74POH | 747 DH1621 |16]16/16 7003 #DIV/0}
#DIV/O!
#DIV/O!
#DIV/O!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMPPSI |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE | GAL/STK SPM GPM AVDP | AVDC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM
1 |National 10P130| 6.0 10 3.5 0 0 1
2 |National 10P130| 6.0 10 35 0 0 CONFIDENTIAL REPORT 2
3 0 3
i %% %% 0 [ [ [ o | I I i
BRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
BOTTOM HOLE ve]14]  Lenam 0.D. 10. FORMATION MD ™D LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
8 1/2" bit 1.00] 8500 Navajio 5,901 5,901 SS Co Man 435-979-2202
Bit sub 3.53 6.625 2.88 Mudiogger
25 - SWDP 767.91 5.000 3.00 Toolpusher
Jar 3253]  6.500 2.75 R TR ————]———TRF e ——]| Last BOP Test 715
4 - SWDP 12328  5.000 3.00 | | ] Next BOP Test 8/4
SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 7/26
GAS UNITS FROM 0 ROP (FTHR) Last BOP Drill 7126
Last Operate Pipe Ra} 7/26
Last Operate Blind R4 7/26
TOTAL 928.25 Last Operate Annular] 7/26
STRING WT. BHA WT. POWT. | i g GRD. ELEVATION | _GLTOKE | KB ELEVATION |SURF GSG INT CASING 1 NT Egmez PROD CSG__|
150 50 152 148 o || 5793 26 5819 | 1915 (7000) (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION] OLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+ / W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
[ — . DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 7:00 { 7.00 Circ. w/ rig pump @ 6 bblpm
7:00 | 0:00 | 4.00 Pump 2nd stage cement, See attached csng & cement report.
0:00 | 12:00 | 1.00 RD Cementers & csng head
12:00] 15:00 | 3.00 Unscrew landing jt. Set pack off bushing, back off running tool, pack off P-seals to 8500 psi test to 7500 psi.
15:00] 16:30 | 1.50 Set wear bushing, strap & caliper 29 jts. 5" Spiral wt. DP
16:30| 18:00 | 1.50 start laying down 6 1/2" DC's
18:00| 20:00 | 2.00 Run temperature log cement top @ 1100
20:00 | 22:00 | 2.00 LD rest of 6 1/2" DC's
22:00| 0:00 | 2.00 TiH, picking up 5" spiral wt. DP
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 This am drill plugs, float & 80' cement.
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00




Engineering and Supervision EXACTE ng ineeri ng, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office

Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oll Co of Utah, LLC DAI LY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
[DATE ELT CONTRACTOR 'COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR |
07/27/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 DL Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
30 POOH to PU vertitrak 7,051 48 2.00 24.0 Kaibab 14,500
MUD DATX
[~ DATETIME DEFTH WT VIS PV 13 GELS _ |FILTRATE] CAKERZ ] SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC | LCM
7/27/6;pm | 7003 8.4 30 | |
BITDATA
[BIT] SiZE | MFG. TYPE JADG | SERIAL NO. JETS (173200°) L} BOT | TOOTACE | TOORS ROP MTF] RPM | WOB ] BULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT«MTR T B G
98500 RTC | to7apon| 747 | DH1621 |18[16{16 7003 48 2.00 24.0 N] 60 { 30
#DIV/O|
#DIV/O!
#DIV/O!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMP PSI |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE | GAL/STK SPM GPM AVDP | AVDC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM
1 {National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 0 0 1
2 |nationaltoriad 60 | 10 | 35 | o | o | CONFIDENTIAL REPORT | -
3 0 3
0 [ T 1T o I [ D%
DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
[BOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLth 14 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
8 1/2" bit 1.00] 8500 Navajio 5,901 5,901 SS Co Man 435-979-2202
Bit sub 3.53 6.625 2.88 Mudlogger
25 - SWDP 767.91 5.000 3.00 Toolpusher
Jar 3253]  6.500 2.75 — s —Trs Last BOP Test 75
4 - SWDP 123.28]  5.000 3.00 I | | Next BOP Test 8/4
SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 7/27
GAS UNITS FROM 0 ROP (FTHR) Last BOP Drill 7127
Last Operate Pipe Ral 7/27
Last Operate Blind R4 7/26
TOTAL ssesl Last Operate Annular]_7/26
[STRING WT. BHA WT, PUWT. SOWT. ROT. TORQUE| GRD. ELEVATION | _GLTOKB | KB ELEVATION [SURFCSG | NTCASNG1 || INTCASNG2 | PRODCSG
170 50 175 | 165 | 900 | 5763 26 5819 | 1915 6,985 {14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH VD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
[ — DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 2:30 | 250 TIH, picking up 5" spiral wt. DP
2:30 | 3:00 | 0.50 Drill thru stage tool
3:00 | 4:30 [ 1.50 TIH to plugs on float collar
4:30 | 8:00 | 3.50 Drill plugs, float collar & 80' cement to 6975
8:00 | 9:00 | 1.00 Circ plugs & rubber out of hole. Held bop drill.
9:00 | 18:30 | 9.50 Dump & clean mud tanks, fill w/ fresh water, displace salt mud in hole,mud up to 30 vis.
18:30 | 19:00 | 0.50 Drill 10' cement, clean out rat hole, FIT to 9.0 emw.
19:00{ 21:00 | 2.00 Drill 7003 to 7051
21:00§ 22:00 | 1.00 Circ & condition, starting to get good mud around.
22:00| 0:00 | 2.00 PQOH to pu vertitrak
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 6am on btm. Starting to drill w/ vertitrak
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00




Engineering and Supervision EXACTE ng ineeri ng, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Ol Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE 4’W_E[L CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE APi¥ SUPERVISOR
07/28/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 DL Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
31 Drilling 7,390 339 18.00 18.8 Kaibab 14,500
MUD DATA
[ DATENTIME DEPTH WT Vis PV P GELS _ JFILTRATE] CAKE/2]  SOLIDS SAND P GHLORIDES SALT CALC | LoM
7/28/08:00{ 7088 8.4+ 39 9 9 89 |[120] 1 1.00 tr 10.8 11,000 | 18,150 | 160
BITDATA
[BIT] SiZE | WFG. TVPE TADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/320d) LYy TOT T TS0 "FOP M RPM ]| WOB ] OULL CONDITION |
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B G
9| 8500 | RTC | orapon | 747 | DH1e21 |18|18]16 7003 | 7051 | 48 2.00 24.0 N| 60 | 30 [1]1]
RRY 8.500 | RTC [ to7aron| 747 | DH1621 [16]16]16 7051 339 | 18.00 18.8 v| 85 | 35
#DIV/01
#DIV/O!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMPPSI |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE | GAL/STK SPM GPM AVDP | AVDC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH 7250
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 65
1 |National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 | 120 | 420 1 | 750
2 [National 10P130] 6.0 10| 35 0 0 CONFIDENT/AL REPORT 2
3 0 3
420 | 217 [ 357 [ 1300 100 [ 1se | &7 | Y Y
[ DR STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
lBOTfOM HOLE ASSEMBLV‘I 1 5 LENGTH 0.0. 1.D. FORMATION MD ™D LITHO LOGY R!G INFO
le 172" bit 1.00]  8.500 Navajio 5,901 5,901 ss Co Man 435-979-2202
VertiTrak(motor) 30.78 7.063 np Kayenta 7,135 7,135 Mudlogger
Float sub 3.49 5.000 np Wingate 7,254 7,254 Toolpusher
Filter sub 555  6.500 2.94 I T——Trs—] Last BOP Test 715
Xo 1.85]  5.000 2.5 41 19 | 20 | 208 Next BOP Test 8/4
8 1/4 stab. / Xo 7.96 6.500 2.81 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 7/28
25 - SWDP 767.91]  5.000 3.00 GAS UNITS FROM TO ROP (FTHR) Last BOP Drill 7127
Jar 32.53 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra] 7/27
4 - SWDP 123.28 3.00 Last Operate Blind R4 7/26
TOTAL oraast Last Operate Annular] 7/26
TRING WT, “BHA WT. P . SO WT. ROT. TORQUE| GRD. ELEVAT GL TO KB KB ELEVATION [SURF CSG [ ING 1 INTCASING2 | PROD C5G
196 55 205 | 195 | 1 5703 28 5,819 1915 6,985 (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVOD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- SEE;ON DLS TOOL
[ _ . DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 0:30 | 0.50 POQH

0:30 § 1:00 | 0.50

Rig service, replace tong torque sensor

1:00 | 2:00 | 1.00

PU vertitrak assembly

2:00 | 5:00 | 3.00

TIH

5:00 | 6:00 | 1.00

Circ. Surv, Wash 50' to btm.

6:00 | 0:00 | 18.00

Drill & survey 7051 to 7390

0:00

0:00

Detected some seepage @ 7220, 4-6 bblhr. Started sifting nutplug & mica, 10 sks. Hr.

0:00

7325 losses increased to 15-20 bbihr. Mix & pump 60 bbl. LCM 20 nutplug, 10 mica

0:00

Losses minimal 1-2 bblhr. Continue sifting nutplug & mica 5 sks. Hr each.

0:00

Total losses last 24 hrs. 120 bbls.

0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00

0:00

6am drilling @ 7493

0.00

0:00

Daily Total 24.00




Engineering and Supervision EXACT Eng i neer i ng ) Inc- (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oii Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWELL CONTRAGTOR COUNTY, STATE . ] SPUD DATE APIR 'SUPERVISOR
07/29/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT I 6/28/07 43-041-30047 DL Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TO FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
32 TiH w/ bit #10 7,651 261 16.50 15.8 Kaibab 14,500
I — MUD DATA —
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRA’ CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
7/29/08:00] 7500 8.4+ 42 13 14 o | os ] 1 1.00 tr 10.0 9,000 14,850 | 110
— BIT DATA
[BIT] SiZE MFG. TYPE TADC SERIAL NO. JETS (173200 W] O0T ] ro0TAeE T ToUre ROP MTF RPM ] WOB ] DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T|8 G
98500 | RTC | to7aron | 747 | DH1621 |16]16[16 7003 | 7051 48 2.00 24.0 N] 60 | 30 |1]1 |
98500 | RTC | to7eron | 747 | DH1621 [18|16]16 7051 | 7651 | 600 34.50 17.4 Y| 85 | 35 {4]|4]| 1
10 8.500 | STC | re7voor{ 747 | MY1931 |1s8|16]16 7651 #DIV/O!
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SLOW PUMIP PSI
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE| GAL/STK SPM GPM AVDP | AVDC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHPAN2 ECD DEPTH 7651
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 60
1 [National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 100 | 350 1 600
2 |National 10P130 6.0 10 3.5 0 0 CONF/DENTIAL REPORT 2
3 0 3
350 | 181 | 208 | 1100] 100 | 101 | ses |
I DRILL STRING — GEOLOGIC ~ GENERALINFG |
IBOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLV#I 16 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
8 1/2" bit 1.00] 8500 Navajio 5,901 5,901 SS Co Man 435-979-2202
VertiTrak(motor) 30.78 7.063 np Kayenta 7,135 7,135 Mudlogger
Float sub 3.49 5.000 np Wingate 7,254 7,254 Toolpusher
IFiner sub 5.55|  6.500 2.94 — U Last BOP Test 7/5
Xo 1.85]  5.000 2.25 41 19 | 20 | 208 Next BOP Test 8/4
8 1/4 stab. / Xo 7.96] 6.500 2.81 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 7/29
25 - SWDP 767.91]  5.000 3.00 GAS UNITS FROM 0 FOP (FTIHR) Last BOP Drill 7/27
Jar 32.53 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra| 7/27
4 - SWDP 123.28]  5.000 3.00 Last Operate Blind R{ 7/26
TOTAL 974.35 Last Operate Annular| 7/26
[ STRRGWT. | BrAWT ] W, ____|ROY. YORQUE GRD. ELEVATION | GLTOKE | KB ELEVATION [suRFcsa | T CASING T ] —wmsiue;z—?#w
196 55 210 | 190 | [ 5793 26 5818 | 1915 6,985 {14500)
~ SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- | SECTION| DLS TOOL
[ f DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 6:00 | 6.00 Drill & survey 7390 to 7490 losses varied 2-10 bblhr. Pump 25ppbl icm sweep @ 7400
6:00 | 7:00 | 1.00 lost 100% returns while on btm. Drilling, pu off btm. 50% returns. Mix & pump 60 bbl. 30ppbl LCM sweep
7:00 | 17:30 | 10.50 Regain circ. Drill & survey 7490 to 7651 rop slowed to 4.6'hr. losses minimal 2-4 bblhr.
17:30| 19:00 [ 1.50 Circ. Btms up, mix & spot 40 bbl. 30 ppbl. Lem pill on btm.
19:00] 21:30 | 2.50 POOH for bit
21:30§ 22:00 | 0.50 Close blind rams, ckeck vertitrak, change bit
22:00| 0:00 | 2.00 TIH, change jars
0:00
0:00 Continue sifting nutplug & mica 2-4 sks. Hr. depending on losses
0:00 Lost 180 bbl. Last 24 hr.
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 6am drilling @ 7682
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




Engineering and Supervision EXACTE ng ineeri ng, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC DA' LY DR'LL' NG REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
[OATE TWeLL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE APk SUPERVISOR
07/30/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT I 6/28/07 43-041-30047 DL Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TO FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
33 Drilling 7,849 198 23.00 8.6 Kaibab 14,500
— MUD DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRA’ CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
7/30/08:00 7500 8.4+ 43 14 20 9/12 I 9.4 I 1 1.00 tr 10.8 7,500 14,850 90
BITDATA
[BT] SIZE | MFG. TVPE | IADC | SERIALNO. JETS (1732nd") ™ TOT | TOOTASE [ TRoUrS FOP MR RPM ] WOB ] DULL CONDIION |
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T|8 G
10] 8.500 | STC | Fe7voDR | 747 MY1931 |16|16]16 7651 198 23.00 8.6 Y] 0-84] 35
#DIV/0t
#DIV/O}
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMPPST |
PUMP | MANUFACTURER LNER | sTROKE]| GAL/sTk | sem | oPm | avDp | Avoc | puMp |  MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH | 7651
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 60
1 |National 10P130¢ 6.0 10 3.5 110 | 385 1 600
2 |Natonaltopad_60 | 10 | 35 | o | o | CONFIDENTIAL REPORT | =
3 0 3
7///’/’;’i /e Rres. |/
BRILL STRING GEOLOQGIC ) GENERALINFO |
[BOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLV#I 16 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
8 1/2" bit 1.00 8.500 Thrust fault 7,660 7,660 Co Man 435-979-2202
VertiTrak(motor) 30.78 7.063 np Twin creek 2] 7,883 7,883 ] Mudlogger
|Float sub 3.49 5.000 np Toolpusher
Filter sub 555  6.500 2.94 SR .1 U — Last BOP Test 7/5
Xo 1.85] 5.000 2.25 4 a2 | 3g i Next BOP Test 34
18 1/4 stab. / Xo 7.96 6.500 2.81 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 7/30
25 - SWDP 767.91 5.000 3.00 GAS UNITS FROM T ROP (FTHR) Last BOP Drill 7/30
Jar 32.53 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ral 7/30
4 - SWDP 123.28 3.00 Last Operate Blind R4 7/30
TOTAL Last Operate Annular| 7/26
STRING W1 BHA WT. ROQUH] X [T GLTOKB | KB ELEVATION JSURFCSG | INTCASNG1T || INT CASING 2 PROD C5G
196 55 220 | 190 | I 5703 26 5819 | 1915 6,985 (14500)
SURVEYS
MO INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- |SECTION| DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- | SECTION] DLS TOOL
— — — DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM T0 HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 1:00 { 1.00 TIH
1:00 | 0:00 | 23.00 Drill & survey 7651 to 7849
0:00
0:00 Losing 15 bblhr. @ 120 spm. (420 gpm) 7680"
0:00 Losses minimal to nil @ 110 spm. (380 gpm) 7700’ to 7849’
0:00
0:00 Lost 70 bbl. Last 24 hrs.
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 [0 Y ol o ¥ W T SPPORY
0:00 NELCiVED
0:00 Al
0:00 AUG—U-TZIHW
0:00
0:00 6am drilling @ DIV QF QI GAS-&Mids o
TGOSV G
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
“SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




COFIDENTIAL

Form 3160-5

(April 2004) UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an
abandoned well. Use Form 3160 -3 (APD) for such proposals.

FORM APPROVED
OMB No. 1004-0137
Expires: March 31, 2007

5. Lease Seial No.
UTU-73528

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side.

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well
PeolHoiwer  [Jaaswel [ Other

Wolverine Fed Exploration Unit

8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operalor v 1\ erine Gas & Oil Company of Utah, LLC

Wolverine Federal 17-8
9. API Well No.

3a Address
One Riverfront Plaza, 55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI

3b. Phone No. (include area code)
616-458-1150

4304130047
10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R, M, or Survey Description)

Surface hole location - 2020' FSL & 1610' FWL, NE/4 SW/4 Section 17, T238, R1W
Bottom hole location - 2020’ FSL & 1610' FWL, NE/4 SW/4 Section 17, T23S, R1W

Covenant Field
11. County or Parish, State

Sevier Co, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D Acidize D Decpen D Production (Start/Resume) I:I Water Shut-Off
[ INotice of ntent Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity
Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction ] Recomplete Gther
Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon
EI Final Abandonment Notice D Convert to Injection D Plug Back D Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 31604 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Given:

Surface Casing: 13-3/8" 68ppf J55 BTC surface casing set 7/4/2007 @ 1915 feet kb and cemented to surface

Intermediate Hole: 12-1/4" hole was then drilled into lower Navajo 1 to 7003 feet kb on 7/22/2007 with 10.7ppf salt based mud; open hole logs
run on 7/23 and 7/24.

Report of 9-5/8" Intermediate Casing & Cementing operations 7/25 and 7/26:

Note: Verbal approval for 9.625in casing change from 10,600 to ~7000' given by Al McKee, BLM on 7/23/2007

9-5/8" 47ppf HCP-110 LTC new casing (164 jts) was run to 6985 feet and cemented in two stages (stage tool set at 5671 feet) as follows:

Stage 1: Tail 570 sx 50/50 POZ (25% excess, 14.3ppg, 1.28 cfps); displaced, bumped plug, floats held, open stage tool, circ 9.5 hrs WOC

Stage 2: Lead 170 sx CBM Light ITI (25% excess, 10.5 PPg, 4.29 cfps) and tail w/ 805 sx Class G (25% excess, 15.8ppg, 1.29 cfps)
Temperature log found top of cement behind 9-5/8" casing at 1100 feet as planned.

Well control: BOP stack was not broken, used MBS system, packed off, tested to 7500 psi (5000 psi reqmt), resumed drilling

xc: UDOGM - Dustin Doucet

14. L hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Steven R Hash {

Signature %%124“"4-/

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Title Consulting Engineer - EXACT Engineering Inc

Date 07/30/2007

Approvedby o e o __ Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 US.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 US.C. Section 1212, make ita crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United

RECHIVED

States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

NIV OF OIL. GAS & MINING

(Instructions on page 2)



EXACT Engineering, Inc. www.exactengineering.com

415 S. Boston Ave., Suite 734, Tulsa, OK 74103 « (918) 599-9400 ¢ (918) 599-9401 (fax)

Steven R. Hash, P.E.
Registered Professional Engineer
stevehash@exactenginsering.com

August 20, 2007

Mr. Al McKee CONFIDENTIAL

Bureau of Land Management
Utah State Office

P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

[T =
Mr. Dustin Doucet [)L. | rg Zh i\,f f i A L
Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining IR A
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210

Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Re: Drilling Update #4 - Wolverine Federal 17-8
Sec 17 T23S RO1W
Sevier Co, UT
APl# 43-041-30047

Gentlemen,

On behalf of Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLGC, please find enclosed daily drilling reports for the
subject well from July 31, 2007 through August 19, 2007. Electric logs were run on August 2 and August 10 at
depths of 8319 feet and 9793 feet respectively. We are presently drilling at 11,153 feet toward our anticipated
total depth of 14,500 feet. We respectfully request that the enclosed information remain confidential.

Sincerely,

Sl Rt

Steven R. Hash, P.E.

Enclosures

copy without enclosures via email to:
Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC: Helene Bardolph

EXACT Engineering, Inc. well file RECEIVED
AUG 2 3 2007

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

Petroleum Engineering Consulting, Personnel & Jobsite Supervision
complete well design, construction & management, drilling, completion, production, pupellnes appraisais,
due diligence, acquisitions, procedures, temporary personnel and field supervision




Engineering and Supervision EXACT E ng i neeri ng ) I nc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE “TWELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
08/19/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 DL Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
53 Drilling 11,153 224 24.00 9.3 Kaibab 14,500
MUD DATA
DATE/TIME D‘EFH WT VIS PV YP GELS FSLTRATE"CAKE/SZ SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
8/19/08:00] 11012 8.5 44 15 13 5/7 8.0 l 1 1.50 tr 10.8 1,100 1,815 128
~ BIT DATA
[BIT|  SZE MFG. TYPE TADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd) N OUT | FOOTAGE | HOUARS | ROP . |MTH] RPM | WOB ]_DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RAT+MTR T B G
17] 8.500 | Smith [EFaovBOD1] 617 MX8456 |16]16]16 10238 915 82.50 11.1 Y| 0-84 | 30-35
#DIV/0!
#DIV/0!
#DIV/O!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMPPST |
PUMP | MANUFACTURER uner | sTroke| caListk | sem | aPm | avor | avDc | Pump MOTOR DIFF HHPANZ ECD DEPTH | 10854
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 60
1 |National 10P130f 6.0 10 3.5 0 0 1 600
2 [National 10P130| 6.0 10 35 | 120 | 420 CONFIDEN TIA L RE POR T 2 | 600
3 0 3
B v | e | o [ew | mew | s | s | 7
I BDRILL STRING GEOLOGIC CENERALINFO |
IBOTI'OM HOLE ASSEMBLY# l 21 LENGTH Q.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
8 1/2" bit & bit sub 1.00 8.500 0.00 Wingate 2 9,527 9,527 Co Man 435-979-2202
VertiTrak(motor) 30.50 7.063 np Chilne 9,997 9,997 Mudiogger
|Float sub 3.49 5.000 np Moenkopi 10,520 10,520 Toolpusher
Filter sub 5.55 6.500 2.94 4' T wsc?c?“ T TP GRS Last BOP Test 8/3
Xo 157 5.000 2.25 53 I 2 | 25 Next BOP Test 913
8 1/4 stab. / Xo 7.96]  6.500 2.81 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 8/19
25 - SWbP 767.91 5.000 3.00 GAS UNITS FROM 10 ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill 8/16
Jar 32.53 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra] 8/16
4 - SWDP 123.28 5.000 3.00 Last Operate Blind R4 8/16
TOTAL 973.79 Last Operate Annular| 8/11
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT, SO WT. ROT. TORQUE| GRD. ELEVATION GL TOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
250 55 260 245 5,793 26 5,819 1,915 6,985 (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH VD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION} DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+ /W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
s — DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 0:00 | 24.00 Drili & survey 10929 to 11153
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 Losses 6 bblhr lost 150 bbl last 24 hrs.
0:00 Still sifting 2 sks mica 2 sks nutplug over suction every hour
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 This 6am drilling @ 11200
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
—SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




Engineering and Supervision EXACT Eng ineeri ng, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oll Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWELL CONTRAGTOR TOUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
08/18/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 DL Naylor_
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
52 Drilling 10,929 280 24.00 11.7 Kaibab 14,500
— ~MUD DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRATE{ CAKE/32 $OLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
8/18/08:00] 10748 8.5 43 9 22 5/8 8.8 I 1 1.50 r 10.3 1,100 1,815 108
~BIT DATA
[B] szE | MFG. TVPE TADC | SERIALNO. JETS (1/32nd") N BUT | FOOTAGE | HOURS ROP MR RPM ] WOS ] DULL GONDITION |
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T|] 8 []
17| 8.500 | Smith BFaoyBODY] 617 MX8456 |16]16]16 10238 691 58.50 11.8 Y} 0-84 | 30-36
#DIV/0!
#DIV/OI
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMPPSI |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE | GAL/STK SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH | 10854
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 60
1 |National 10P130} 6.0 10 3.5 0 0 1 600
2 |Nationai 10P130{ 6.0 10 35 | 120 420 CONFIDENTIAL REPORT 2 | s00
3 0 3
R a0 | 2 | s [eow | sew | s | s | 7777778 27
| DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC NEFTAL INFO
ﬁBO'lTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY#I 21 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
8 1/2" bit & bit sub 1.00 8.500 0.00 Wingate 2 9,527 9,527 Co Man 435-979-2202
VertiTrak(motor) 30.50 7.063 np Chilne 9,997 9,997 Mudlogger
|Float sub 3.49 5.000 np Moenkopi 10,520 10,520 Toolpusher
Filter sub 5.55 6.500 2.94 [ISOTTONSUPTIME] BGGAS 1 m%‘%ﬁm I TRIFGAS Last BOP Test 8/3
Xo 157 5.000 2.25 50 | 25 | 25 Next BOP Test /3
8 1/4 stab. / Xo 7.96 6.500 2.81 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting 8/18
25 - SWDP 767.91 5.000 3.00 GAS UNITS FROM TO ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill 8/16
Jar 32.53 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ral 8/16
4 - SWDP 123.28 5.000 3.00 Last Operate Blind R4 8/16
TOTAL 973.79 Last Operate Annularl 8/11
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SOWT. ROT. TORQUY| GRD. ELEVATION GLTOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 P! CsG
245 55 255 240 | 5793 26 5,819 1,915 6,985 (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH VD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+ /W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
_ — —_ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 0:00 | 24.00 Drill & survey 10649 to 10929
0:.00
0:00
0:00
0:00 Losses minimal 2-4 bblhr lost 60 bblm last 24 hrs.
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 This 6am drilling @ 10992
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00




Engineering and Supervision EXACT E ng i neeri ng ’ Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Ol Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWeELL GONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE | SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
08/17/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 DL Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
51 Drilling 10,649 300 22.50 13.3 Kaibab 14,500
— M'Ul) DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRATEI CAKE32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
8/17/08:00f 10462 8.5 45 15 14 6/8 88 | 1 1.50 tr 9.6 1,100 1,815 60
BITDATA
[BIT] SIZE | MrG. TVPE AOC | SEFIAL NO. = JETS (1/32nd) ™ BOT | TOOTAGE | HoU ROP [MTR] RPM | WOB |_DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T| 8 G
17| 8.500 | Smith krsoveopt} 617 | MX8456 |16]16}16 10238 500 34.50 145 Y| 0-84 | 30-35
#DIV/O!
#DIV/O!
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS “SLOW PUMP PSI |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE| GAL/STK SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH | 10500
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSt SPM 50
1 |National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 0 0 1 540
2 |National 10P13{ 6.0 10 35 120 | 420 CONF/DENTIAL REPORT 2 | 540
3 0 3
420 | 218 | 358 | 2000 | 125200 | 176 | 885 | 7
| DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
IBOTI‘OM HOLE ASSEMBLYﬁl 21 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
ls 172" bit & bit sub 1.00|  8.500 0.00 Wingate2 | 9,527 9,527 Co Man 435-979-2202
VertiTrak(motor) 30.50 7.063 np Chilne 9,997 9,997 Mudiogger
Float sub 3.49 5.000 np Moenkopi 10,520 10,520 Toolpusher
Filter sub 555  6.500 294 frormomsrr s Tt ——mraE—] Last BOP Test 8/3
Xo 157  5.000 2.25 50 [ 25 25 Next BOP Test 93
8 1/4 stab. / Xo 7.96] 6.500 2.81 SHows Last Safety Meeting | 8/17
25 - SWDP 767.91]  5.000 3.00 GAS UNITS FROM 0 ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill 8/16
Jar 32.53 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra] 8/16
4 - SWDP 123.28|  5.000 3.00 Last Operate Blind R{ 8/16
TOTAL o379 A Last Operate Annular| 8/11 |
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUH| GRD. ELEVATION GLTOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
245 55 255 | 240 | | 5793 26 5,819 1,915 6,985 (14500)
— SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+ /W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
[ _ _ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 7:30 | 7.50 Drill & survey from 10349 to 10465
7:30 | 8:00 [ 0.50 Work thru fractures 10455 to 10465, high torque & pressure, losing 6 bblhr.
8:00 | 9:00 | 1.00 Drill & survey from 10465 to 10480
9:00 | 9:30 | 0.50 Work thru rubble 10450 to 10480, high torque & pressure, losing 8 bblhr. Pumped 15 ppbbl Nutplug & mica.
9:30 | 11:30] 2.00 Drill & survey 10480 to 10497
11:30] 12:00 | 0.50 Work thru rubble 10490 to 10497, high torque & pressure, losing 8 bblhr.
12:00] 0:00 | 12.00 Drill & survey 10497 to 10649
0:00
0:00 Hole taking 5-6 bblhr. Lost 150 bbl last 24 hrs.
0:00 Did not mix any LCM thru this interval, needed to get mud properties in line, monitor losses to determine
0:00 future cource of action.
0:00 This am mixed & pumped 15 ppbbl nut plug & mica sweep. 4am.
0:00 Sifting 1sk mica, 1 sk nutplug p/hr. over suction has slowed losses to 2-3 bblhr.
0:00
0:00 Hole seems to have stabilized, drilling ahead
0:00
0:00 This 6am drilling @ 10722
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
—3EE XTTACHED COSTDETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




Engineering and Supervision EXACT E ng i neeri ng ’ Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE = [WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
08/16/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 DL Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
50 Drilling 10,349 115 13.00 8.8 Kaibab 14,500
MUD DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRATE|] CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
8/16/08:00| 10238 8.5 55 18 19 8/11 96 | 1 1.50 tr 11.0 1,100 1,815 70
~BIT DATA
[BIT] SiZE MFG. TYPE TADC SERVAL NO. = JETS (1/a2nd") =T OuT ] TOOTAGE ] FHOURS FOP Wi eM ] WOB | DULL CONDITION |
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B G
16| 8.500 | Smith | re7voor | 747 | MY1932 |20|20]16 10038] 10238| 200 44.50 45 y| 084 [3035]/7]2] In
17| 8.500 | Smith praoveopi] 617 | Mx8456 |16}16]16 10238 114 12.00 95 Y| 084} 35
#DIV/O!
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS —SLOW PUMP P51 |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE | GAL/STK SPM GPM AV DP AVDC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH | 10127
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PsI SPM 50
1 |National 10P130| 6.0 10 3.5 0 0 1 520
2 [National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 120 | 420 CONFIDENTIAL REPORT 2 | 520
3 0 3
T voo | 2 | ose [eom | vzsew | s | e | W77 L
DHILL STRING GEOLOGIC CENERACINFO |
[BOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY# l 21 LENGTH O.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD ™D LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
8 1/2" bit & bit sub 1.00] 8.500 0.00 Kayenta2 | 9410 9,410 Co Man 435-979-2202
VertiTrak(motor) 30.50 7.063 np Wingate 2 9,527 9,527 Mudlogger
Float sub 3.49 5.000 np Chilne 9,997 9,997 IToolpusher
Filter sub 5.55 6.500 294 | T ﬁs::%&n“m; T P eAs | Last BOP Test 8/3
Xo 1.57]  5.000 2.25 50 | 25 | 25 Next BOP Test /3
8 1/4 stab. / Xo 7.96] 6.500 2.81 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 8/16
25 - SWDP 767.91]  5.000 3.00 GAS UNITS FROM 0 ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Dril 8/16
Jar 32.53 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra] 8/16
4 - SWDP 123.28]  5.000 3.00 Last Operate Blind RY 8/16
TOTAL 37507 A Last Operate Annular| 8/11 |
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SOWT. ROT. TORQUHl GRD. ELEVATION GLTOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
245 55 255 | 240 | I 5703 26 5,819 1,915 6,985 (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N4/S- E+ / W- SECTION} DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
[ — DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM 7O HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 1:00 ] 1.00 Drill & survey from 10234 to 10238
1:00 | 6:00 | 5.00 PQOH for bit
6:00 | 7:00 | 1.00 Change bit motor, clean filter sub.
7:00 | 12:00 | 5.00 TIH no fill,
12:00] 0:00 | 12.00 Drill & survey from 10238 to 10349
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 Lost 30 bb! on trip 1 inch pop offs @ btms up looks like 10060, ECD slowed pop offs & not seeing any more in
0:00 samples. @ 10325 hit fractured rubble quarter size pop offs, stalled motor & had 60k drag. Cleaned up & back
0:00 drilling. May have to raise wt. lost 40 bbl while drilling 12:00 to 24:00 lost 70 bbl last 24 hr. no losses @ presen
0:00 6am drilling @ 10442
0:00
Daily Total 24.00

SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




Engineering and Supervision EXACTE ng ineeri ng, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oll Co of Utah, LLC DA' LY DR"..L'NG REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWELL CONTRACTOR . COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE APIE SUPERVISOR
08/15/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 DL Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
49 Drilling 10,234 95 24.00 4.0 Kaibab 14,500
— MUD DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRATE[ CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
8/15-08:00] 10170 8.5 48 16 15 6/8 9.2 I 1 1.50 tr 11.0 1,100 1,815 60
BIT DATA
BTS2t | MrG. ] TYPE | IAGC | SERIALNG. JETS (173200 ™ BOT | FOOTAGE | HOURS ROP TR RPM ] WOB ] DULL GONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T|B G
16| 8.500 | Smith | Fe7YODR | 747 MY1932 |20]20]16 10038 196 43.50 4.5 Y] 0-84 |30-35] 7] 2 In
#DIV/O! Y 084] 35
#DIV/0!
#DIV/O!
HYDRAULICS — SLOWPUMPPSI |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE]| GAL/STK SPM GPM AVDP | AVDC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH | 10127
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PS| SPM 50
1 |National 10P130 6.0 10 3.5 0 0 1 520
2 [National 10P130 6.0 10 35 | 120 | 420 CONFIDENTIAL REPORT 2 | 520
3 0 3
420 | 218 | 358 | 1725 ] 125200 | o0s2 | 885 |
—DRILL STRING “GEOLOGIC
EOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY# I 20 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
8 1/2" bit & bit sub 1.00 8.500 0.00 Kayenta 2 9,410 9,410 Co Man 435-979-2202
VertiTrak(motor) 30.74 7.063 np Wingate 2 9,527 9,527 Mudlogger
Float sub 3.49 5.000 np Chilne 9,997 9,997 Toolpusher
[Fitter sub 555  6.500 2,00 |morrORSTrI S ———mre—] Last BOP Test 8/3
Xo 1.57 5.000 2.25 49.3 25 25 Next BOP Test 9/3
8 1/4 stab. / Xo 7.96 6.500 2.81 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 8/14
25 - SWDP 767.91 5.000 3.00 GAS UNITS FROM To ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill 8/11
Jar 32.53 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra| 8/11
4 - SWDP 123.28 5.000 3.00 Last Operate Blind R4 8/13
TOTAL 974.03 Last Operate Annular| 8/11
| STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUEl GRD. ELEVATION GL TO KB K8 ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
239 55 252 228 II 5,793 26 5,819 1,915 6,985 (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+ / W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
_ — — DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM T0 HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 0:00 | 24.00 Drill & survey from 10139 to 10234
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 No losses last 24 hrs.
0:00
0:00 6am trip for bit @ 10238
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
—ZEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS.




Engineering and Supervision EXACTE ng ineeri ng, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oll Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE = WELL CONTRAGTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
08/14/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
48 Drilling 10,139 101 19.50 5.2 Kaibab 14,500
— MUD DATA
DATETME | DEPTH WT VIS & P GELS _ |FILTRATE] CAKE32 ] SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT TALC ] LoM
8/14-08:00f 10059 8.4+ 48 16 12 5/8 8.8 l 1 1.25 tr 10.8 1,100 1,815 60
~ BITDATA
[BIT]  szE MFG. TYPE TDC | SERIAL NO. “JETS (1/32nd") N o Vi FOOTAEETW ROP M RPM 1 WOB ] DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B G
15| 8.500 | Reed |enpsipaxd 617 | LUB514 {16]16]16 10021[10038| 17 8.00 2.1 v] 084 |3035]7]2] In
16| 8.500 | Smith | re7vopr | 747 | MY1932 [20]|20]|16 10038 101 19.50 5.2 Y| o84] 35
#DIV/O!
#DIV/01
HAYDRAULICS SLOWPUMP PSI |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE | GAL/STK SPM GPM | AVDP | AVDC | PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH | 10127
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSt SPM 50
1 |National 10P130| 6.0 10 35 0 0 1 | 520
2 [National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 | 120 | 420 CONF/DENTIAL REPORT 2 | 520
3 0 3
420 | 218 | 358 | 1725 ] 125200 | o092 | 870 |
I BRILL STRING GEOLOGIC CENERALINFO |
lBOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY# I 20 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
8 1/2" bit & bit sub 1.00] 8500 0.00 Kayenta2 | 9,410 9,410 Co Man 435-979-2202
VertiTrak(motor) 30.74 7.063 np Wingate 2 9,527 9,527 Mudlogger
Float sub 3.49 5.000 np Chilne 9,997 9,997 Toolpusher
Filter sub 555 6500 | 294 |moromorme—oros T tow [—Tareas—] Last BOP Test 813
Xo 157]  5.000 2.25 8 | 32 | 36 Next BOP Test 913
8 1/4 stab. / Xo 7.96 6.500 2.81 SHOWS Last Safety Mesting | 8/14
25 - SWDP 767.91]  5.000 3.00 GAS UNITS FROM 0 ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill 8/11
Jar 3253 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Raj 8/11
4 - SWDP 123.28]  5.000 3.00 Last Operate Blind R 813
TOTAL 493 Last Operate Annular| 8/11
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SOWT. ROT. TORQUH . GLTOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CS
239 55 252 | 228 | | 5793 26 5,819 1,915 6,985 (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH VD N+/S- E+ /W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
— ‘ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 4:00 | 4.00 Trip into 9949
4:00 { 4:30 | 0.50 Wash to 10038’ no fill clean bottom
4:30 | 0:00 | 19.50 Drill & survey from 10038’ to 10139’
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 Well took 39 bbls over last 24 hours
0:00
0:00 Well taking 1-2bbls drilling fluid/hour
0:00
0:00 10167 Drilling @ 0630 hour
0:00
0:00
Daily Total | 24.00
SEE ATTACHED COSTDETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




Engineering and Supervision EXACT Eng i neeri ng ) l nc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oli Co of Utah, LLC DA' LY DR".L'NG REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE Twew CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE API¥ 'SUPERVISOR
08/13/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TO FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
47 Check VertiTrak change bits 10,038 17 8.00 2.1 Kaibab 14,500
MUD DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS F!LTRATWIS? SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
8/13-08:00] 11021 8.4+ 51 17 19 8/12 7.2 I 1 1.25 tr 10.8 1,100 1,815 60
BIT DATA
[BIT] SizE MFG. TYPE | IADC SERIAL NO. JETS (173200 T BUT | FOOTAGE | HOURS RoP o IMTA] RPM ] WOB ] DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T|B [<]
15| 8.500 | Reed |EHPs1DAKH 617 LU8514 116|16]16 10021] 10038| 17 8.00 2.1 Y| 0-84 ]30-35] 7| 2] In
16} 8.500 | Smith | Fe7vopR | 747 MY1932 [20]20]16 10038 #DIV/0! Y
#DIV/0!
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SCOWPUMPPSI |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE| GAL/STK SPM GPM AVDP | AVDC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH 9870
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 50
1 |National 10P130 6.0 10 3.5 0 0 1 575
2 |National 10P130| 6.0 10 35 120 | 420 CONF/DENTIAL REPORT 2 580
3 0 3
e ) se0 | 2s [ as s | vesew | i | eno | Dl
I DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC ~GENERALINFO |
IBOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY#I 20 LENGTH Q.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
le 172" bit & bit sub 1.00] 8.500 0.00 Kayenta 2 9,410 9,410 Co Man 435-979-2202
VertiTrak(motor) 30.74 7.063 np Wingate 2 9,527 9,527 Mudlogger
Float sub 3.49 5.000 np Chilne 9,997 9,997 Toolpusher
Filter sub 555  6.500 2.94_|lsorromsor e T o —— TP Last BOP Test 8/3
Xo 1.57]  5.000 2.25 %6 | 32 | 36 | Next BOP Test 973
8 1/4 stab. / Xo 7.96] 6.500 2.81 SHows Last Safety Meeting | 8/13
25 - SWDP 767.91 5.000 3.00 GAS UNITS FROM To ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill 8/11
Jar 32.53 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Raj 8/11
4 - SWDP 123.28]  5.000 3.00 Last Operate Blind R4 813
TOTAL 974.03 Last Operate Annularl 8/11
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SOWT. ROT. TORQUHE GRD. ELEVATION GL TOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 ROD C.
237 55 251 226 5,793 26 5,819 1,915 6,985 (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+ / W- SECTION| OLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
[ _ _ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 2:00 | 2.00 Trip out
2:00 | 2:30 | 0.50 Change bit-work blind rams
2:30 | 4:30 | 2.00 Trip in @ 0500 hour.
4:30 | 6:00 | 1.50 Cut & slip 125’ drifling line
6:00 | 8:30 | 2.50 Trip into 9921’
8:30 | 9:00 | 0.50 Wash & ream 9921' to 10021’ - 1' fill
9:00 | 10:00 | 1.00 Decode VertiTrak
10:00| 18:00 | 8.00 Drill & survey from 10021’ to 10038'
18:00] 23:30 ] 5.50 Trip out
23:30| 0:00 | 050 Inspect VertiTrak -change bits
0:00
0:00
0:00 Well took 9 bbls over last 24 hours
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 10049' Drilling @ 0630 hour
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COS TS




Engineering and Supervision EXACT Eng ineeri ng, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Ol Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE “TWeLL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE " APIE SUPERVISOR
08/12/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TO FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
46 Check VenrtiTrak change bits 10,021 138 19.50 7.1 Kaibab 14,500
— _ MUD DATX
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRATE[ CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
8/11-08:00] 9793 8.4+ 51 17 19 9/11 70 | 1 1.25 tr 10.0 1,200 1,980 90
BITDATA
BI] SEZE | MFG. TPE TADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd") ~N OUT ] TOGTAGE | HOURS ROP MTF] RPM ] WOB ] DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B G
15| 8.500 | Reed [eHPeiDakd 617 | LUB514 [16]16[16 10021 10038) 17 8.00 2.1 Y| o084]3035{7)2] In
16| 8.500 | Smith | rervoor | 747 | MY1932 (20]20]16 10038 #DIV/O! Y
#DIV/0l
#DIV/OI
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMPPSI |
PUMP | MANUFACTURER uNEr | sTRoke| caL/sk | sem | aPm | avoe | avoc | Pump |  MoTORDIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH | 9870
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 50
1 |National 10P130] 6.0 10 3.5 0 0 1 575
2 |National 10p130, 60 | 10 | 35 | 120 a20| CONFIDENTIAL REPORT | =2 |ss0
3 0 3
7 ] o0 | 2 | sss |0 ] sesen | ame | ses |
| DRILL STRIRG GEOLOGIC
IBOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY*I 1 9 LENGTH 0.D. 1D, FORMATION MD TVD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
ls 172" bit & bit sub 1.00] 8500 0.00 Kayenta2 | 9,410 9,410 Co Man 435-979-2202
IVertlTrak(motor) 30.74 7.063 np Wingate 2 9,527 9,527 Mudlogger
|Float sub 3.49 5.000 np Chilne 9,997 9,997 Toolpusher
|Finer sub 5.55]  6.500 294 _|morromsor s o ——mreE—]) Last BOP Test 8/3
Xo 1.57]  5.000 2.25 46 I 36 Next BOP Test 9:3
8 1/4 stab. / Xo 7.96| 6.500 2.81 SHOWS Last Safety Mesting | 1/8
25 - SWDP 767.91]  5.000 3.00 GAS UNITS FROM 0 ROP (FTHR) Last BOP Drill 8/11
Jar 32.53] 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra] 8/11
4 - SWDP 123.28]  5.000 3.00 Last Operate Blind R 8/13
TOTAL 97493 Last Operate Annular| 8/11
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUEE GRD. ELEVATION GL TOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROO CSG
237 55 251 | 226 | | 5703 26 5,819 1,015 6,985 {14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD Ne/S- E+/W- |SECTION] DLS TOOL MO INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
_ - DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 19:30 | 19.50 Drill & survey from 9883’ to 10021’
19:30] 22:00 | 2.50 Circ. Hole clean & spot 60 bbls 45% nut plug-muilti seal-mica from 7880 to 6775'
22:00| 0:00 | 2.00 Trip out due to p. rate
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 Well 8 bbls drilling fluid over dispiacement on trip out
0:00
0:00 Well tock 7-12 bbls/hr while drilling
0:00 Well took 179 bbls over last 24 hours
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 Trip in @ 0500 hour.
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
SEEATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




Engineering and Supervision EXACT Eng i neeri ng ] l nc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC DA".Y DR".L'NG REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWeLL GONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
08/11/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
45 Drilling 9,883 90 11.50 7.8 Kaibab 14,500
MOL BATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRATa CAKER2 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
8/11-08:00] 9793 8.4+ 49 15 15 7/10 7.2 ] 1 1.25 tr 10.0 1,200 1,980 90
BITDATA
[BT] S2Ze | Mro. TYPE TADC | SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd) ] OUT | FOOTAGE | HOUMS ROP WTA] RPM ] WOB |_DULL CONOITION |
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B G
12| 8.500 | Reed | TD74PDH | 747 DH1668 ]16]16]16 9269 | 9787 518 61.50 8.4 Y| 0-84 |30-35] 7] 2] 1/16"
13] 8.500 | Reed | TD7aPDH | 747 | DH1624 [16]16]16 9787 | 9793 6 3.00 2.0 N| 45 10 |2({2] In
14} 8.500 | Reed | To74poH | 747 | Rerun #13 [16]16]16 9793 90 11.50 7.8 Y| o084] 30
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS — SLOW PUMP PST |
PUMP | MANUFACTURER LUNER |sTRoke| cAL/sTK | sem | aPm | avop | avoc | Pump MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH | 9870
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PS) SPM 50
1 [National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 0 0 1 575
2 [National 10P130| 6.0 10 35 120 | 420 CONFIDENT/AL REPORT 2 | s80
0 3
420 | 218 [ 358 [ 16s0] 75150 | 17a | ses |
| DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO___ |
IBOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY#I 19 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
|8 1/2" bit & bit sub 1.00] 8.500 0.00 Kayenta 2 9,410 9,410 Co Man 435-979-2202
IVertiTrak(motor) 30.74 7.063 np Wingate 2 9,527 9,527 Mudlogger
|Fioat suo 3.49 5.000 np Toolpusher
Filter sub 5.55] 6500 2.94_|lmormomormme—mrms Tt — Last BOP Test 8/3
Xo 1.57]  5.000 2.25 6 | 32 | 36 | Next BOP Test 973
8 1/4 stab. / Xo 7.96] 6.500 2.81 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 8/11
25 - SWDP 767.91]  5.000 3.00 GAS UNITS FROM To ROP (FTHR) Last BOP Drill 8/11
Jar 32.53 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Raj 8/11
4 - SWDP 123.28 5.000 3.00 Last Operate Blind R4 8/11
TOTAL, 974.03 Last Operate Annular| 8/11
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SOWT. ROT. TORQUHI GRD. ELEVATION GLTOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
235 55 250 225 5,793 26 5,819 1,915 6,985 (14500)
SURVEYS
MO INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+ /W- ] SECTION DLS TOOL
[ — — DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 8:00 | 8.00 Log - rig down loggers
8:00 | 12:00 | 4.00 Pickup VertiTrak - trip into 9736’
12:00] 12:30 | 0.50 Wash from 9736' to 9793' 2' fill
12:30| 0:00 | 11.50 Drilt & survey from 9793' to 9883’
0:00
0:00 Logs =
0:00 Density / Neutron - TD-7880
0:00 Array Induction / Gamma-Ray - TD-7880
0:00 Borehole Compensated Sonic - TD-7880
0:00 Formation Imager / Dipmeter - TD-8300
0:00 MSCT (Cores) @ 8267'-8288'-8325'-8353'-8415'-8460'-8490'-8517'-8565'-8615'-8690'-8710'-8740"-8755-877(
0:00 8800'-8825'-8850'-8920'-9060'-9150'-9197'-9300'-9405-9440' - Recovered all 25 cores
0:00
0:00 Well taking 0-1 bbls/hour of drlling fluid while logging
0:00
0:00 Well held drilling fluid untill 1700 hour then started taking fluid @ a rate of 11 bbis/hr
0:00
0:00 Well took 83 bbls. Drilling fluid last 24 hours
0:00 9970 Drilling @ 0800 hour.
Daily Total 24.00
SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




Engineering and Supervision EXACT Eng ineeri ng, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE “TWELL GONTRACTOR. COUNTY, STATE | SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
08/10/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
44 Qg_gjng 9,793 6 3.00 2.0 Kaibab 14,500
— MUD DATA
DATETTIME ] DEPTH wT VIS PV YP GELS _ JFILTRATE| CAKES2 | _SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
8/10-08:00] 9793 8.4+ 47 15 15 711 7.0 | 1 1.25 tr 10.0 1,400 2,310 90
~ BIT DATA
[BT] SZE | WrG. TVPE TADC | SERIAL NO. ~JETS (1/32nd") T 0T | FOOTAGE | " ROP WTR] RPM ] WOB | _OULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T| B G
12| 8.500 | Reed | To7aPoH | 747 | DH1668 |16|16]16 9269 | 9787 | 518 61.50 8.4 v| 0-84 | 30-35§ 7] 2] 116"
13| 8500 | Reed | To74PDH | 747 | DH1624 |16]16]|16 9787 | 9793 6 3.00 2.0 No| 45 10 |2]2} In
#DIV/0!
#DIV/0!
AYDRAULICS SLOW PUMP PSI |
puMP | MANUFACTURER uner | stroke| aaListk | sem | aem | avoe | avoc | pump MOTOR DIFF HHP/AN2 ECD DEPTH | 9544
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSt SPM 50
1 |Nationai 10P130] 6.0 10 35 120 | 420 1 580
2 |National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 0 0 CONFIDENTIAL REPORT 2 nc
3 0 3
) o | o | s [isw] soiw | m | ses | ik
—DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC ~—GENERACINFO |
IBO'ITOM HOLE ASSEMBLYII‘ 1 8 LENGTH Q.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
Wz“ bit & bit sub 4.46]  8.500 0.00 Kayenta 2 9,410 9,410 Co Man 435-979-2202
[VertiTrak(motor) 7.063 np Wingate 2 9,527 9,527 Mudiogger
|Fioat sub 5.000 np Toolpusher
Filter sub 6.500 2.94 1 % T THIP GAS Last BOP Test 8/3
Xo 5.000 2.25 43 I 2 | 36 Next BOP Test 93
8 1/4 stab. / Xo 6.500 2.81 SHOWS Last Safety Mesting | 8/10
25 - SWDP 767.911  5.000 3.00 GAS UNITS FROM 0 ROP (FTIHR) Last BOP Drill 8/6
Jar 32.53 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra} 8/6
4 - SWDP 123.28 5.000 3.00 Last Operate Blind R4 8/10
TOTAL 928.18 Last Operate Annular{ 8/3
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUH| GRD. ELEVATION GL TOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CS5G
234 55 248 | 224 | | 5703 26 5,819 1915 6,985 (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/5- E+/W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- €+ /W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
— DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 3:30 | 3.50 Trip in
3:30 | 4:00 | 0.50 Wash & ream 46' to bottom 5 fill
4:00 | 7:00 | 3.00 Drill from 9787 to 9793’
7:00 | 830 | 1.50 Circ. & spot 60 bbls. Of 15% multi seal-nutplug-mica from 9793’ to 8646'
8:30 | 9:30 | 1.00 Trip out 9793' to 8748
9:30 | 10:00] 050 Spot 60 bbls. Of 15% multi seal-nut plug-mica from 8748 to 7603’
10:00| 10:30 | 0.50 Trip out 8748' to 7705’
10:30] 11:00] 0.50 Spot 60 bbls. Of 15% multi seal-nut plug-mica from 7705’ to 6602'
11:00] 15:00 | 4.00 Trip out 7705' to surface - w ork blind rams
15:00| 0:00 | 9.00 Rig up loggers & log
0:00
0:00 Well took 49 bbls. Last 24 hours.
0:00
0:00 Well taking 0 bbis/hour of driling fluid while logging
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
—SPE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




Englneering and Supervision EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE (WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE APl# SUPERVISOR
08/09/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
43 Trip in 9,787 62 12.00 5.2 Kaibab 14,500
MUD BATA
DATE/TIME DE-PTH wT VE PV YP GELS Fm CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
8/8-08:00 | 9613 8.4+ 47 15 15 711 70 | 1 1.25 tr 10.0 1,400 2,310 | 90
“BIT DATA
[BIT] SIZE MFG. “TYPE G | SERIAL NO. JETS (1732nd) ™o ] OUT | FOOTAGE ] HOURS ROP VT RPM ] WOB | OULL CONDITION |
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T] B G
12| 8.500 | Reed | TD74PoH | 747 | DH1668 [16]16]16 9269 | 9787 | 518 61.50 8.4 Y| 084 {3035 7] 2| 1/18"
13] 8500 | Reed | To7epon | 747 | DH1624 |16]16{16 9787 #DIV/O!  [No
#DIV/O!
#DIV/O!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMP PSI |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE | GAL/STK SPM GPM AVDP | AVDC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH 9544
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 50
1 [National 10P130] 6.0 10 3.5 120 | 420 1 | 580
2 |Natonaitoriao] 60 | 10 ] a5 | o | o | CONFIDENTIAL REPORT [ 2 | ne
3 0 3 :
R a0 | e | sse s ] s | on | see | V777727277
I DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
IBO'I'I'OM HOLE ASSEMBLV#I 17 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD ™D LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
8 1/2” bit & bit sub 4.46] 8.500 0.00 Kayenta2 | 9,410 9,410 Co Man 435-979-2202
VertiTrak(motor) 7.063 np Wingate 2 9,527 9,527 Mudlogger
|Float sub 5.000 np Toolpusher
|Finer sub 6.500 2.94_|Imorronsor e —peme T s — TS Last BOP Test 8/3
Xo 5.000 225 43 | a2 36 Next BOP Test 93
8 1/4 stab. / Xo 6.500 2.81 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 8/8
25 - SWDP 767.91] 5.000 3.00 GAS UNITS FROM 0 ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill 8/6
Jar 32.53 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra] 8/6
4 - SWDP 123.28]  5.000 3.00 Last Operate Blind R 8/8
TOTAL 28180 Ak Last Operate Annular| 8/3
STRING WT. BHA'WT. PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUE{ GRD. ELEVATION GLTOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
234 55 248 | 224 | | 5703 26 5,819 1,915 6,985 (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+ /W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
[ — — DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 3:30 | 3.50 Drill & survey from 9725' to 9746’
3:30 | 6:00 | 250 Check pumps-Regenerate VertiTrak
6:00 | 14:30 | 8.50 Drill & survey from 9746' to 9787’
14:30] 21:30 | 7.00 Trip out -work blind rams-lay down VertiTrak & x-o-ibs
21:30| 0:00 | 2.50 Pickup bit sub trip in hole
0:00
0:00
0:00 Well took 21 bbls drilling fluid over displacement on trip out
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 Well took 86 bbls. Last 24 hours.
0:00 :
0:00 Well taking 6 bbls/hour of drlling fluid
0:00
0:00
0:00 9790’ Drilling @ 0500 hour
0:00 Loggers while be on location @ 1500 hour today.
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




Engineering and Supervision

EXACT Engineering, Inc.

(918) 599-9400 office

Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oll Co of Utah, LLC

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

24 hrs - midnight to midnight

DATE TWELL CONTRAGTOR COUNTY, STATE | SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
08/08/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
42 Drilling 9,725 141 23.00 6.1 Kaibab 14,500
| WUD DATX _
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS F|LTRATE[ CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
8/8-08:00 9613 8.4+ 47 15 15 711 7.0 I 1 1.25 tr 10.0 1,400 2,310 90
BITDATA
BT SiZE MFG. TYPE 1ADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd) N OUT | TOOTAGE | HOURS ROP MTR| RPM ] WOB | DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T{8 G
12] 8.500 | Reed | TD74PDH | 747 DH1668 |16}16]16 9269 456 49.50 9.2 Y] 0-84 | 30-35
#DIV/0!
#DIV/0!
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS — SLOW PUMNP PSI
pUMP |  MANUFACTURER UNER | sTRokE| caL/stk | sem | apm | avor | avoc | pump MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH | 9544
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 50
1 |National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 110 | 385 1 580
2 |National 10P130) 6.0 10 3.5 0 0 CONFIDENTIAL REPORT 2 nc
3 0 3
777 7 ) ses [ oo | sm0 [wrso]| o520 | 1as | sse | Dk
DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALCINFO |
BOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY# I 1 7 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
8 1/2" bit 1.00 8.500 0.00 Kayenta 2 9,410 9,410 Co Man 435-979-2202
VertiTrak(motor) 30.74 7.063 np Wingate 2 9,527 9,527 Mudlogger
Float sub 3.49 5.000 np Toolpusher
Filter sub 555 6500 2.94 — s ——Tmres—]| Last BOP Test 8/3
Xo 1.57 5.000 2.25 43 32 36 ] Next BOP Test 9:3
8 1/4 stab. / Xo 7.96] 6.500 2.81 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 8/8
25 - SWDP 767.91 5.000 3.00 GAS UNITS FROM T0 ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Dirili 8/6
Jar 32.53 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra| 1/8
4 - SWDP 123.28 5.000 | 3.00 Last Operate Blind R4 8/6
TOTAL 97403 )V Last Operate Annular| 8/3 |
STRING WT. BHA WT, PUWT. SOWT. ROT. TORQUB| GRD. ELEVATION GLTOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
232 55 249 | 222 | | 5703 26 5,819 1,915 6,985 (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
— — DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 { 1:00 | 1.00 Drill & survey from 9584' to 9588'
1:00 | 2:00 | 1.00 Service rig - top drive-spot sweep on bottom - hole stayed full while serviced rig
2:00 | 0:00 | 22.00 Drill & survey from 9588' to 9725'
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 Mixed & pumped 1-50 bb! pill 20#/bbl Muilti seal & mica-45 vis-8.4+wt.
0:00
0:00 Well took 238 bbls. Last 24 hours.
0:.00
0:00 Well taking 9 bbls/hour of drlling fluid
0:00
0:00
0:00 9747 Drilling @ 0600 hour
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00




Engineering and Supervision EXACT Eng i rleel'i ng ’ Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oll Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE | SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
08/07/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
41 Drilling 9,584 256 23.50 10.9 Kaibab 14,500
— MUD DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRATE] CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
8/7-08:00 | 9448 8.4+ 46 15 15 711 70 | 1 1.25 tr 10.8 1,500 2,475 90
BIT DATA
[BIT] Szt MFG. | TYPE ] WADC SERIAL NO. “=JETS (132na") ™ BUT | FOOTAGE | HOURS RoP mem
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T] 8 G
12| 8500 | Reed | To7apoH | 747 | DH1668 |16]16]16 9269 315 26.50 11.9 v | 0-84 [ 30-35
#DIV/O!
#DIV/0!
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMPPSI |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE| GAL/STK SPM GPM AVDP | AVDC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH 9580
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PS| SPM 60
1 |National 10P130| 6.0 10 35 120 | 420 1 700
> natonar 1013060 | 10 ] 35 1 o | o | CONFIDENTIAL REPORT [ = nc
3 0 3
420 | 219 | 360 | 1675 ] 50125 | 178 | 866 | Do
~— DRILL STRING el {o] Mo e [eF CERETCNT
BOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLV#I 17 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG iINFO
8 1/2" bit 1.00] 8.500 Kayenta2 | 9,410 9,410 Co Man 435-979-2202
VertiTrak({motor) 30.74 7.063 np Wingate 9,527 9,527 Mudlogger
Float sub 3.49 5.000 np Toolpusher
[Fitter sub 555 6500 294 L ——mras—) Last BOP Test 8/3
Xo 1.57| 5.000 2.25 43 32 36 | Next BOP Test 9/3
8 1/4 stab. / Xo 7.96] 6.500 2.81 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 8/8
25 - SWDP 767.91]  5.000 3.00 GAS UNITS FROM T0 ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill 8/6
Jar 32.53 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ral 1/8
4 - SWDP 123.28]  5.000 3.00 Last Operate Blind R 8/6
TOTAL 974.03 %/////////////4%/////% Last Operate Annular] 8/3
[ STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUH GLTOKB KB ELEVATION  [SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
228 55 248 | 215 | | 26 5,819 1,015 6,985 (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH VD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD NCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- €+ /W- | SECTION! DLS TOOL
_ — ~ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 21:00 | 21.00 Drill & survey from 9328' to 9572’
21:00| 21:30 | 0.50 Service rig - top drive-spot sweep on bottom - hole stayed full while serviced rig
21:30] 0:00 | 2.50 Drill & survey from 9572' to 9584'
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 Mixed & pumped 3-50 bbl pill 40#/bbl nut plug & mica-45 vis-8.4+wt.
0:00 Mixed & pumped 1-50 bbl sweep 5#/bbl nut plug & mica-105 vis 8.4+wt.
0:00 Well took 388 bbls. Last 24 hours.
0:00
0:00 Well taking 15 bbls/hour of drlling fluid
0:00
0:00
0:00 9610' @ 0615 hour drilling
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




Engineering and Supervision EXACTE ng ineeri ng, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oll Co of Utah, LLC DA' LY DR“.L'NG REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWelr CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
08/06/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
40 Drilling 9,328 184 9.00 20.4 Kaibab 14,500
~ MUD DATA
_[WTI-ME DE?H WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRATHCAKE/& SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
8/6-08:00 | 9267 8.4+ 50 15 20 913 60 | 1 1.25 tr 11.0 1,700 2,805 90
BITDATA
[BR] Sz | WrG. TYPE TADG | SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd") L 0T | TOOTAGE | HOURS. ROP WTR] APM | WOB | _DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T| B G
11| 8500 | STC | rervoor| 747 | MY1938 |16[16]16 8319{ 9269 | 950 51.50 18.4 Y{o84]| 35 16[2] In
12| 8500 | Reed | To74pDH | 747 | DH1668 {16]16]16 9269 59 3.00 19.7 Y| 0-84 |28-32
#DIV/0I
#DIV/O!
HYDRAULICS SCOWPUMP P31 |
PUMP | MANUFAGTURER UNER | sTRokE| GaL/sTk | sem | aPm | avor | avoc | pump MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD OEPTH 9363
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 60
1 |National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 120 | 420 700
2 |National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 0 0 CONFIDENTIAL REPORT nc
3 0 3
) v | 20 | s [om | soe | o | st | WL
I DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC —CENERALWNFO |
IBOTl'OM HOLE ASSEMBLY&I 17 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
8 1/2" bit 1.00f  8.500 Thrust fault | 7,660 7,660 Co Man 435-979-2202
VertiTrak(motor) 30.74 7.063 np Twincreek 2| 7,883 7,883 Mudlogger
Float sub 3.49 5.000 np Navajo 2 8,201 8,201 [Toolpusher
Filter sub 5.55 6.500 2.94 Emmwr‘rm I % T Traas | Last BOP Test 8/3
Xo 157]  5.000 2.25 43 | 32 | 36 [ Next BOP Test /3
8 1/4 stab. / Xo 7.96 6.500 2.81 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting 8/7
25 - SWDP 767.91]  5.000 3.00 GAS UNITS FROM 0 ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill 8/6
Jar 32.53 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe R 1/8
4 - SWDP 123.28]  5.000 3.00 Last Operate Blind R 8/6
TOTAL. 974.03 Last Operate Annular| 8/3
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SOWT. ROT. TORQUEI GRD. ELEVATION GL TOKB KB ELEVATION [SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
222 55 240 209 5,793 26 5,819 1,915 6,985 (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD Na/S- E+/W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZMUTH TVD N4/S- €+ /W- | SECTION OLS TOOL
| — o DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 6:00 | 6.00 Drill & survey from 9144' to 9269'-pump pressure increased 400 psi.
6:00 | 8:30 | 250 Circ. Hole clean spot 50 bbl/of #40/obl nut plug & mica_from 9050’ to 8095’
8:30 | 13:30| 0.50 Trip out 12,000-15,000 over pull no tights spots-work blind rams
13:30) 14:30 | 1.00 Change out VertriTrak-bit-bad bearings in VertiTrak was the cause of pump pressure increase
14:30| 20:00 | 5.50 Trip in-fill pipe test tool @ 1101'-fill pipe @ 3714'- {ill pipe @ 5535' fill pipe @ 7242" fill pipe @ 9209
20:00| 21:00 | 1.00 Set VertiTrak-wash from 9209' - 9269'-120 spm 1625 psi 1-2000 wt.-6' fill
21:00| 0:00 | 3.00 Drill & survey from 9269’ to 9328'
0:00
0:00
0:00 Mixed & pumped 2-50 bbl pill 40#/bbl nut plug & mica-45 vis-8.4+wt.
0:00 Well took 16 bbls mud over displacement on trip out-stayed full while handeling Bha.
0:00 Well took 184 bbls. Last 24 hours.
0:00
0:00 Well taking 14 bbls/hour of driling fluid
0:00
0:00
0:00 9408’ Drilling @ 500 hour
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 19.50

—SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




Engineering and Supervision EXACTE ng ineeri ng, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWELL CONTRAGTOR COUNTY, STATE | SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
08/05/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
39 Drilling 9,144 400 19.00 21.1 Kaibab 14,500
_MUDDATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PY YP GELS FILTRATE] CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
8/5-08:00 | 8917 8.4+ 41 12 13 57 7.0 1 1.25 tr 10.8 2,000 3,300 | 90
BIT DATA
[BT] SZE | Mra ] TYPE TRDC | SEFIAL NO. JETS (17320 ™ SUT | FOOTAGE | HOURS. ROP WTE] RPM ] WOB | OULL CONDITION |
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T]B [€]
11| 8500 | STC | rervopr| 747 | MY1938 [16]16]16 8319 825 45.50 18.1 Y| 084) 35
#DIV/0!
#DIV/0!
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMP PST |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE| GAL/STK SPM GPM AVDP | AVDC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH 9015 9015
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 40 60
1 |National 10P130| 6.0 10 3.5 0 0 1 nc nc
2 |National 10P130{ 6.0 10 35 110 | 385 CONFIDENTIAL REPORT 2 | 245 | 450
3 0 3
7 ses | 2o [ s [ s 52 | s | sss | 777777/ 1
I DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALIRFO |
[BOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY#I17 LENGTH 0.D. +.D. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
8 1/2" bit 8.50| 8.500 Thrust fault | 7,660 7,660 Co Man 435-979-2202
VertiTrak(motor) 30.78 7.063 np Twin creek 2| 7,883 7,883 Mudlogger
|Float sub 3.49 5.000 np Navajo 2 8,201 8,201 Toolpusher
Filter sub 555  6.500 2.94 O e s Last BOP Test 8/3
Xo 1.85]  5.000 2.25 45 2 | 36 Next BOP Test 9/3
8 1/4 stab. / Xo 7.96] 6.500 2.81 SHows Last Safety Meeting | 8/6
25 - SWDP 767.91]  5.000 3.00 GAS UNITS FROM 0 ROP (FTTHR) Last BOP Drill 8/3
Jar 32.53 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ral 8/3
4 - SWDP 123.28] _ 5.000 3.00 Last Operate Biind R 8/3
TOTAL 98185 v Last Operate Annular| 8/3
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUY} GRD. ELEVATION GL TOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
220 55 235 208 | | 5793 26 5,819 1,915 6,985 {14500)
~SURVEYS
MO INCL. AZIMUTH TVD Na+/S- E+/W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/8- E+ /W- | SECTION. DLS TOOL
[ — _ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 15:30 | 15.50 Drill & survey from 8744' to 9081’
15:30] 16:00 { 0.50 Circ. Spot 50 bbls 35#/bbl of nut plug & mica 8850' to 7905' - 44 vis to seal hole
16:00) 16:30 | 0.50 Short trip 9081' to 8888’ pull 50,000 over string wt.-had to pump out 110 spm 1400 psi.
16:30] 17:00 ] 0.50 Work stuck pipe @ 8888’ packed off-work lose-regain circ.
17:00| 19:00 | 2.00 Trip out 8888' to 7824' pull 50,000 over string wt.-had to pump out 8888' to 8004' 120 spm 1475 psi.
19:00] 20:00 | 1.00 Trip in 7824’ to 8987"-wash threw bridge @ 8451- wob-1-3000-120 spm-1475 psi
20:00| 20:30 | 0.50 Wash from 8987' to 9081" -no fill-wob-1-3000-120 spm-1475 psi.
20:30{ 0:00 | 3.50 Drill & survey from 9081’ to 9144’
0:00
0:00 Mixed & pumped 5-50 bbl pill 40#/bbl nut plug & mica-90 vis-8.4+wt.
0:00 Well taking 27 bbls./hour of drilling fluid while drilling-took 8 bbls. Durning short trip
0:00 Well took 544 bbls. Last 24 hours. Total since drilled out 2651 bbls.
0:00
0:00 Short trip due to tight conn. Formation cutting changed from unconsoladated 1o consoladated
0:00 Cuttings over shaker changed from fine sand to pee size sand some a little bigger than pee size cutting
0:00 Excess amount of pee size cutting coming over shaker when sweeps return to surface raised vis to 45
0:00 Last sweep across shaker next to normal amount of cutting came over.
0:00 9252' Drilling @ 0500 hour
0:00
Daily Total 24.00

SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




Engineering and Supervision EXACT E n g i nee ri n g ) Inc . (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Ol Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE APIN SUPERVISOR
08/04/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
38 Drilling 8,744 371 23.00 16.1 Kaibab 14,500
_ MUD DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRATEl CAKE32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
8/4-08:00 8457 8.4+ 40 10 13 57 8.0 I 1 1.25 tr 10.8 2,200 3,960 90
BITDATA
Eil BE3 MFG, TYPE JADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd) N OUT ] FOOTAGE | HOURS ROP MTR] RPM ] WOB ] _DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B G
11} 8500} STC | re7vopR | 747 | MY1938 [16]16[16 8319 425 26.50 16.0 Y| o084] 35
#DIV/0!
#DIV/Q!
#DIV/O!
HYDRAULICS SLOW PUMP PSI |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE| GAL/STK | SPM GPM | AVDP | AVDC | PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH | 8703 | 8703
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSI SPM 40 60
1 |National 10P130] 6.0 10 3.5 0 0 1 nc ne
2 INational 10p130 60 | 10 | 35 | 120 | «20| CONFIDENTIAL REPORT [ 2 |220] 410
3 0 3
7 ) ] 0] e ] s [raw] st | s | eer | D7 s
I DRILL STRING ~GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO_ |
'BOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY# I 1 7 LENGTH Q.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
8 1/2" bit 8.50 8.500 Thrust fault 7,660 7,660 Co Man 435-979-2202
VertiTrak(motor) 30.78 7.063 np Twincreek 2] 7,883 7,883 Mudlogger
Float sub 3.49 5.000 np Navajo 2 8,201 8,201 Toolpusher
Filter sub 555 6.500 294 _|orromsur e mEms e —— TS Last BOP Test 8/3
Xo 1.85]  5.000 2.25 39 I 2 | 36 Next BOP Test 9/3
8 1/4 stab. / Xo 7.96 6.500 2.81 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting 8/5
25 - SWDP 767.91]  5.000 3.00 GAS UNITS FROM 0 ROP (FTHR) Last BOP Drill 8/3
Jar 32.53 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra] 8/3
4 - SWDP 123.28]  5.000 3.00 Last Operate Blind R4 8/3
TOTAL wiesl Y Last Operate Annuiw
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUE| GRD. ELEVATION GLTOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
212 55 226 | 200 | [ 5703 26 5,819 1,915 6,985 (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION| DOLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+ /W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
. — . DAILY ACTIVITY,
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 8:00 | 8.00 Drill & survey from 8373' to 8458'
8:.00 | 9:00 | 1.00 Recycle VertiTrak pulser quit shortly after pumping sweep-service rig-pulser working
9:00 | 0:00 | 15.00 Drilt & survey from 8458’ to 8744’
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 Midnight to 0630 well holding fluid
0:00 0630 to 1330 well taking drilling fluid rate of 23 bbls/hr.
0:00 1330 to midnight well holding fluid
0:00 Mixed & pumped 1-50 bbl pill 40#/bbl nut plug & mica
0:00 Well took 163 bbls of drilling fluid over last 24 hours
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 8867 Drilling @ 0545 hour
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




Engineering and Supervision EXACT E ng i neeri n g ’ In C. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oll Co of Utah, LLC DA' LY DR“—L'NG REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
08/03/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
37 Drilling 8,373 54 3.50 15.4 Kaibab 14,500
— —_ MUD DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRATE| CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
8/3-08:00 8319 8.4 53 18 19 10/14 8.0 I 1 1.00 tr 10.0 2,400 3,960 90
BIT DATA
[BT] SkE | WrG. TVPE TADC | SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd") ™ UT | FOOTAGE | HOURS ROF WTR] RPM ] WOB | DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+«MTR T]8 G
111 8.500 | STC | Fe7voDR | 747 MY1938 |16{16/16 8319 54 3.50 15.4 Y] 0-841 35
#DIV/0!
#DIV/O!
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS SLOW PUMP PSI |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE | GAL/STK SPM GPM AV DP AV OC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH 8180
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PS) SPM 65
1 |National 10P130| 6.0 10 3.5 100 | 350 1 660
2 |National 10r130_ 60 | 10 | 35 | o | o | CONFIDENTIAL REPORT | 2 |eeo
3 0 3
i w0 | w1 [ eos ] s | wo | s | 7777
| BRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
I;OTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLV#I 1 7 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
8 1/2" bit 8.50 8.500 Thrust fault 7,660 7,660 Co Man 435-979-2202
VertiTrak(motor) 30.78 7.063 np Twin creek 2| 7,883 7,883 Mudlogger
[Fioat sub 3.49 5.000 np Navajo 2 8,201 8,201 Toolpusher
Filter sub 5.55 6.500 2.94 |[BOTTOMSUPTIME] _BGCAS | GNscD N T rreas | Last BOP Test 8/3
Xo 1.85]  5.000 2.25 5 | 32 | 36 Next BOP Test 913
8 1/4 stab. / Xo 7.96] 6.500 2.81 SHows Last Safety Meeting | 8/4
25 - SWDP 767.91 5.000 3.00 GAS UNITS FROM TO ROP (FTHR) Last BOP Drill 8/3
Jar 32.53 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra| 8/3
4 - SWDP 123.28 5.000 | 3.00 Last Operate Blind RJ 8/3
TOTAL %187, Last Operate Annular] 8/3
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUE| GRD. ELEVATION GL TOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
203 55 227 | 192 | | 5703 26 5,819 1915 6,985 (14500)
— SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH VD N+/8- E+ / W- SECTION| OLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+ /W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
[ _ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:

0:00 | 1:00 | 1.00

Log & rig down loggers

1:00 | 3:00 | 2.00

Cut & slip 125' drilling line

3:00 | 5:00 | 2.00

Pull wear bushing wait on bop tester

5:00 | 14:00 ] 9.00

Test upper & lower pipe rams - blind rams - her valve - kill line valves - check valve - manuall choke line valve

14:00] 0:00 Choke manafold - super choke - top drive valves - floor saftey valve - dart valve - choke line
0:00 Tested all above @ 250 psi for 5 min each & 5000 psi for 10 min each
0:00 | 14:00 Tested annular @ 250 psi for 5 min & 2500 psi for 10 min

14:00] 15:00| 1.00

Pickup vertitrak bit & trip into 442'

15:00| 15:30 | 0.50

Accumulater function test Oked acc.& all bop test by Jeff Brown with BLM

15:30] 20:00 | 4.50

Trip in fill pipe every 2000’

20:00] 20:30 | 0.50

Wash & ream 78' to bottom 15' fill

20:30} 0:00 | 3.50

Drill & survey from 8319' to 8373’

0:00

0:00 Well taking 18 bbls of drilling fluid /hour during logging-bop test-trip in-after reaming to bottom
0:00 Cutting on bottom sealed formation untili 630 am.

0:00 Well taking 23 bbls/hour

0:00 Drilling @ 8452' @ 0700 hour

0:00

0:00 Well took 360 bbls drilling fluid over last 24 hours.

Daily Total 24.00

SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COSTS




Engineering and Supervision EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE TWELL CONTRAGTOR COUNTY, STATE | SPUD DATE APIE SUPERVISOR
08/02/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
36 Logging 8,319 0 0.00 #DIV/0! Kaibab 14,500
MUBD DATA
m DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS m CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
8/2-08:00| 8180 8.4 40 8 12 5/8 90 | 1 1.00 tr 10.8 3,200 5,280 90
BIT DATA
[BIT] SizE MFG. TVPE TADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/aznd) N GOT | FOOTAGE | HOURS. — ROP MTR| FRPM | WOB ] DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RAT+MTR T] 8 G
10{ 8.500 | STC | rervoor | 747 | MY1931 |16|16}16 7651 | 8319 | 668 68.00 9.8 Y| o084] 35 |4]2] 1/8"
#DIV/O!
#DIV/O!
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS —SLOWPUMPPSI |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE{ GAL/STK | SPM GPM | AvDP | AvDc | PuMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD OEPTH | 8180

NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PS) SPM 65

1 |National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 100 | 350 1 660

2 INatonai1op1ad 60 | 10 | 35 | 0 | o | CONFIDENTIAL REPORT |2 [

3 0 3
7 s | e [ 2o (o] e | e | s | 777///8
I DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
IBOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLV#I 16 LENGTH Q.D. I.D. FORMATION MD ™VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
8 1/2" bit 8.500 Thrust fault | 7,660 7,660 Co Man 435-979-2202
VertiTrak{motor) 7.063 np Twincreek 2| 7,883 7,883 Mudlogger
|Float sub 3.49 5.000 np Toolpusher
Filter sub 555 6500 2.94_|lsorromsor e —Brms T o — Last BOP Test 7/5
Xo 1.85]  5.000 2.25 s | 32 | 36 Next BOP Test 8/4
8 1/4 stab. / Xo 7.96] 6.500 2.81 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 8/3
25 - SWDP 767.91]  5.000 3.00 GAS UNITS FROM T0 ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Dril 7/30
Jar 32.53 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ra] 7/30
4 - SWDP 123.28]  5.000 3.00 Last Operate Blind R _8/2

TOTAL 9257 Last Operate Annular| 7/26
STRING WT. BHA WT, PUWT. SOWT. ROT. TORQUH} GRD. ELEVATION GLTOKB KB ELEVATION JSURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
202 55 225 | 190 | I 5793 26 5,819 1,915 6,985 (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/8- E+ /W- SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVO N+/S- E+/W- | SECTION DLS TOOL
- — DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | :30 | 0.50 Short trip to shoe @ 6985’
:30 | 1:30 | 1.00 Trip in 6985' to 8319' no fill
1:30 | 4:30 | 3.00 Circ. & cond. Hole for logs pump 50 bbl. 40#/bbl nut plug & mica sweep hole
4:30 | 8:30 | 4.00 Trip out for logs lay down Veritrak work blind rams
8:30 | 0:00 | 15,50 Rig up & log first log to bottom @ 1130 loggers TD = 8301"
0:00 3 logging runs = Wave Sonic, Dip Meter (XRMI) , Induction, Density-Neutron 20 Side wall core points
0:00 Depth of core points 7910'-7920'-7930'-7980'-8004'-8006'-8028'-8040'-8050'-8060'-8068'-8076'-8090°-8096'
0:00 8100'-8104'-8125'-8210-'8220'-8230"-Recovered all 20 cores
0:00 Well took 38 bbls drilling fluid during short trip
0:00 While circ.well took 36 bbls. Drilling fluid rate of 12 bbls/hour
0:00 On trip out well took 21bbls. Drilling fluid over displacement of tubeulars to fill hole
0:00 While logging well was stable for a short time then started taking drilling fluid @ a rate of 18 bbls./hour
0:00
0:00 Well took 351 bbils. Drilling fluid over last 24 hours
0:00
0:00
0:00 0500 Testing bops
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
SEE ATTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE COS1S




Engineering and Supervision EXACT E ng i neeri ng ’ Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oll Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE B TV R— CONTRAGTOR COUNTY, STATE ] SPUD DATE AP SUPERVISOR
08/01/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
35 Short trip for logs 8,319 158 21.00 7.5 Kaibab 14,500
_ —_WUDDATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH WT VIS PV YP GELS FILTRATEI CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
8/1/08:00 | 8180 8.4+ 44 14 14 7/9 90 | 1 1.00 tr 9.0 3,800 6,270 90
— BITDATA
[BIT] SZE | MFG. TYPE TADC | SERIAL NG. JETS (1732nd") N SUT ] TOOTAGE | R FOP MTA[ FPM ] WOB | _DULL CONDIION |
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T] B G
10| 8500 | STC | Fervoor | 747 | MY1931 |16]16|16 7651 ] 8319 | 668 68.00 9.8 Y|o084| 35
#DIV/O1
#DIV/0}
#DIV/0!
HYDRAULICS — SLOW PUMP PSI |
puMP | MANUFACTURER uUNER | sTroke| caLsstk | sem | aem | avor | avbc | pume MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH 1
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSt SPM 65
1 |National 10P130] 6.0 10 35 100 | 350 1 660
2 |National 10P130{ 6.0 10 3.5 0 0 CONF/DENTIAL REPORT 2 | 660
3 0 3
350 | 181 | 205 | 1210 125 | 110 | se5 |
| DRILC STRING GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO |
rBOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLYkl 16 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD VD LITHO LOGY RIG INFO
8 1/2" bit 1.00] 8.500 Thrust fault | 7,660 7,660 Co Man 435-979-2202
VertiTrak(motor) 30.78 7.063 np Twin creek 2| 7,883 7,883 "Mudlogger
Float sub 3.49 5.000 np Toolpusher
Filter sub 5.55| _ 6.500 2.94 | e Last BOP Test 715
Xo 1.85]  5.000 2.25 4 2 | 36 | Next BOP Test 8/4
18 1/4 stab. / Xo 7.96| 6.500 2.81 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 8/1
25 - SWDP 767.91]  5.000 3.00 GAS UNITS FROM 0 ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill 7/30
Jar 32.53 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Rai 7/30
4 - SWDP 123.28]  5.000 3.00 Last Operate Blind R{ 7/30
TOTAL 974.35 Last OwAnnularl 7/26
STRING WT. BHA WT. PUWT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUEI GRD. ELEVATION GLTOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
202 55 225 | 190 5,793 26 5,819 1915 6,985 (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- |SECTION] DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- £+ /W- | SECTION| DLS TOOL
L — — DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 6:00 | 6.00 Drill & survey from 8161' to 8180'
6:00 | 7:00 | 1.00 Mix & pump 2-50 bbl lcm pills 35#/bbl nut plug & mica pills
7:00 | 22:00 | 15.00 Drill & survey from 8180’ to 8319’
22:00] 23:00 | 1.00 Circ. Bottoms up cond. Mud for logs
23:00| 0:00 | 1.00 Short trip for logs had to pump first two stands out
0:00
0:00 motor stalling @ reduced rate mix & pump six 50 bbl. 35#pbbl nutplug & mica pills over last 24 hours
0:00 Was loseing 30 bbls/hour drilling fluid last two hours while drilling slowed down to 14 bbls/hour
0:00 Well took 38 bbls drilling fluid during short trip
0:00
0:00 Total fluid loss over last 24 hours was 643 bbils drilling fluid
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 0600 hour trip out for logs
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
—EEE ATTACHED COSTOETAIL PAGE FOR ESTIMATED DRRY HOLE COSTS




Engineering and Supervision EXACT Eng ineeri ng, Inc. (918) 599-9400 office
Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight
DATE WLL CONTRACTO-R COUNTY, STATE S-I;UD DATE Am SUPERVISOR
07/31/07 Wolverine Federal 17-8 SST #68 Sevier, UT | 6/28/07 43-041-30047 DL Naylor
DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ 2400 Hour TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLING TIME ROP TD FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH
34 Drilling 8,161 312 24.00 13.0 Kaibab 14,500
~MUD DATA
DATE/TIME DEPTH wT VIS PY YP GELS FILTRATE| CAKE/32 SOLIDS SAND PH CHLORIDES SALT CALC LCM
7/31/08:00| 7926 8.5 39 10 10 6/8 94 | 1 1.50 tr 11.0 6,500 10,725 | 90
~ BIT DATA
[BT] sz | MrG. TVPE TADC SERIAL NO. “JETS (1/320d") W BUT | FOOTAGE | HOURS ROP WIR| FPM ] WOB | DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B G
10| 8500 | STC | rervoor| 747 | MY1931 [16]16[16 7651 510 47.00 10.9 Y| o084} 35
#DIV/O!
#DIV/O!
#DIV/O!
HYDRAULICS SLOWPUMPPSI |
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE | GAL/STK SPM GPM AVDP | AVDC PUMP MOTOR DIFF HHP/IN2 ECD DEPTH 8100
NO. LENGTH 100% PRESS. PSt SPM 65
1 |National 10P130| 6.0 10 35 112 | 392 1 670
2 Inationai10p1ad_ 60 | 10 ] a5 | o | o | CONFIDENTIAL REPORT | 2 |en
3 0 3
) 5o | o | s [aw] o | e | ees |
I BHRILC STRING GEOLOGIC
ﬁaorrom HOLE ASSEMBLY# l 1 6 LENGTH 0.D. 1.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHO LOGY RiG INFO
8 1/2" bit 1.00|  8.500 Thrust fault | 7,660 7,660 Co Man 435-979-2202
VertiTrak(motor) 30.78 7.063 np Twin creek 2] 7,883 7,883 Mudlogger
|Float sub 3.49 5.000 np [Toolpusher
Filter sub 555{ 6.500 2.94 |worromsurTmEr RS T mggﬁﬁ [ T mraas || Last BOP Test 75
Xo 185  5.000 2.25 4 | 32 | 36 Next BOP Test 14
8 1/4 stab. / Xo 7.96 6.500 2.81 SHOWS Last Safety Meeting | 7/31
25 - SWDP 767.91]  5.000 3.00 GASUNITS FROM 0 ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Drill 7/30
Jar 32.53 6.500 2.75 Last Operate Pipe Ral 7/30
4 - SWDP 12328 5000 | 3.00 Last Operate Blind R4 _7/30
TOTAL 974350 Last Operate Annular| 7/26
STRING WT. BHAWT. PUWT. } SOWT. ROT. TORQUEJl GRD. ELEVATION GL TOKB KB ELEVATION |SURF CSG INT CASING 1 INT CASING 2 PROD CSG
200 55 220 | 190 | I 5793 26 5,819 1,915 5,985 (14500)
SURVEYS
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- SECTION} DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD N+/S- E+/W- | SECTION: DLS TOOL
- — _ DAILY ACTIVITY
FROM TO HRS LAST 24 HOURS:
0:00 | 0:00 | 24.00 Drill & survey 7849 to 8161
0:00
0:00 Drilled 7849 to 8132, 120 spm no losses.
0:00 8132 hole started taking fluid 5 bblhr. Mix & pump 35 # pbbl calcium carbonate pill. @ 100 spm Losses incre.
0:00 20 bblhr. Mix & pump another 35# pbbl! calcium carbonate pill. @ reduced rate 100 spm.
0:00 Drilling @ 8164 raty fractured drilling, lost 100% returns, pu off btm. Regain 80% returns. Try to work back to b
0:00 motor stalling @ reduced rate. Shut down pumps mix & pump 50 bbl. 35#pbbl nutplug & mica pill.
0:00 still experiencing 20 bblhr lo , trying to get thru rubble.
0:00
0:00
0:00 lost 220 bbl. Last 24 hrs. @ 24:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 6am working thru loss circ. & ratty fractured hole @ 8174
0:00
0:00
Daily Total 24.00
—SEEXTTACHED COST DETAIL PAGE TOR ESTIMATED DRY HOLE CO31S




NOTICE

Utah Qil and Gas Conservation Genera! Rule R649-3-21 states that,

> A well is considered completed when the well has been adequately worked to be capable
of producing oil or gas or when well testing as required by the division is concluded.

> Within 30 days after the completion or plugging of a well, the following shall be filed:

Form 8, Well Completion or Recompletion Report and Log

A copy of electric and radioactivity logs, if run

A copy of drillstem test reports,

A copy of formation water analyses, porosity, permeability or fluid saturation
determinations

* A copy of core analyses, and lithologic logs or sample descriptions if compiled

* A copy of directional, deviation, and/or measurement-while-drilling survey for

each horizontal well

Failure to submit reports in a timely manner will result in the issuance of a Notice of Violation
by the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, and may result in the Division pursuing enforcement
action as outlined in Rule R649-10, Administrative Procedures, and Section 40-6-11 of the

Utah Code.

As of the mailing of this notice, the division has not received the required reports for

Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co UT Today's Date: 11/27/2007
Well: APl Number: Drilling Commenced:
Wolverine Fed 17-8  drlg rpts/wer 4304130047 06/16/2007

To avoid compliance action, required reports should be mailed within 7 business days to:
Utah Division of Qil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
F.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801
If you have questions or concerns regarding this matter, please call (801) 538-5284.

cc: Well File
Compliance File



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

CONFIDENTIAL

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU-73528

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

NA

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Wolverine Federal Unit

1. TYPE OF WELL

OIL WELL GASWELL ] OTHER

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Wolverine Federal 17-8

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:

Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC

9. API NUMBER:

4304130047

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:

55 Campau NW Grand Rapids

CITY STATE

PHONE NUMBER:

Ml ,.49503-2616| (616) 458-1150

10. FIELD AND POOL., OR WILDCAT:
Covenant Field, Navajo

4. LOCATION OF WELL

rootaces AT surrace: 2020' FSL and 1602' FWL

COUNTY: Sevier

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NESW 17 238 01W S STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
] Acibize [] oeepen [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
[] NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) [] ALTerRcasiNG [[] eracTure TREAT [[] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [] casinG RePar [[] NewconsTRUCTION [[] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
] cHaNGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [[] operaTORCHANGE [[] TusinG RepPair
[[] cHanGE TUBING [C] PLUG AND ABANDON [[] ventorFLARE
/] SUBSEQUENT REPORT 7] cHanee weLL NaME [] puseack 7] waterRDISPOSAL
{Submit Original Form Only)
[[] cHANGE WELL STATUS [C] PrODUCTION (START/RESUME) [] watersHuT-OFF
Date of work completion:
[[] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE [] otHer:
] convertweLL TyPE ] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

This well was the first of two wells drilled on a single pad. There has been no activity on this well since production casing was
run and cemented on September 15, 2007, and the drilling rig was skidded to the Wolverine Federal 17-9, the other well on the
drill pad. Wolverine Federal 17-8 will be completed after completion activities are finished on the Wolverine Federal 17-9.

nave (pLease print) EN1IS M. Peterson

TITLE

Senior Production Engineer

SIGNATURE M

11/29/2007

DATE

(This space for State use only)

(6/2000)

(See Instructions on Reverse Side)

RECEIVED
DEC 06 2007
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



WOLVERINE GAS AND OIL COMPANY
OF UTAH, LLC

Energy Exploration in Partnership with the Environment

November 29, 2007 L 85 §\§ L 1) H\m M_

Mr. Gil Hunt

Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
P.O. Box 145801

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Re:  Sundry Notices - Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC
Wolverine Federal 17-8
Wolverine Federal 17-9
Wolverine State Twist Canyon 16-1

Dear Mr. Hunt:

Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC respectfully submits the attached Sundry
Notices (Form 9) in duplicate for the referenced wells. The Sundry Notices are to provide
status of wells that have not yet been completed.

Please accept this letter as Wolverine’s written request for confidential treatment of all

information contained in and pertaining to these wells.

Sincerely,

Fllis M. Peterson

Senior Production Engineer
Wolverine Gas and Oil

RECEIVED
DEC 06 2007
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

One Riverfront Plaza * 55 Campau, NW. ¢ Grand Rapids, MI 49503-2616 + 616.458.1150 + FAX 616.458.0869
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STATE OF UTAH ; . FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES ; ¢ d i
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
! UTU-73528
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS PN

Do not use this form for proposals to driil new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Wolverine Federal Unit

1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

oL weLL i GASWELL []  OTHER Wolverine Federal 17-8
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC 4304130047

PHONE NUMBER:

(616) 458-1150

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:

55 Campau NW Grand Rapids Ml ,.49503-2616

STATE

CITY

10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
Covenant Field, Navajo

4. LOCATION OF WELL

rooTaces AT surrace: 2020' FSL and 1602' FWL

17 23S 01W S

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NESW

county: Sevier

STATE:
UTAH

1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

[ Acibize [ oeepen

NOTICE OF INTENT

O

(Submit in Duplicate) ] ALtercasing [C] FrACTURE TREAT
Approximate date work will start: [ casine rRePaR [C] newconsTRucTION
[C] cHANGE To PREVIOUS PLANS [7] operATOR CHANGE
[J crancE TuBING [J PLuc Anp ABANDON
/] SUBSEQUENT REPORT [ cHANGE WELL NAME [0 Pruesack
(Submit Original Form Only)
] cHance weLL sTATUS [C] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME)
Date of work completion:
[[] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE
[ converr weLL TvPe [[] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
TEMPORARILY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR

VENT OR FLARE

WATER DISPOSAL

WATER SHUT-OFF

otHer: Activity Update

RNOOOOOoOooO

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The Wolverine Federal 17-8 and 17-9 wells are both located on the same drilling pad. Surface facilities are being constructed
but there has been no subsurface activity on the Wolverine Federal 17-8 well since production casing was run and cemented
on September 15, 2007. Completion work on the Wolverine Federal 17-8 will commence after the rig activities in progress on
the Wolverine Federal 17-9 are complete.

nawe (Lease privty_ENNIS M. Peterson mme Senior Production Engineer

are 12/27/2007

SIGNATURE M’ EEGEI¥EQ==
(This space for State use only) JAN 04 2008

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MININQQNF ‘HFNJ\ AL

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)



WOLVERINE GAS AND OIL COMPANY
OF UTAH,LLC -

Energy Exploration in Partnership with the Environment

January 29, 2008 F’“‘@Emg;ﬁ“{gﬁﬂ
L

Mr. Gil Hunt

Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
P.O. Box 145801

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Re:  Reporting Forms - Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC
Wolverine Federal 17-8 (UDOGM Sundry Notice)
Wolverine Federal 17-9 (BLM Completion Report and BLM Sundry Notice)

Wolverine State Twist Canyon 161 (UDOGM Sundry Notice)
FED Al

Dear Mr. Hunt:

Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC respectfully submits the enclosed Sundry
Notices (Form 9) in duplicate for the Wolverine Federal 17-8 and Wolverine State Twist
Canyon 16-1. A copy of the BLM Completion Report for the Wolverine Federal 17-9
along with copies of materials required to be submitted with that Completion Report are
also enclosed.

Please accept this letter as Wolverine’s written request for confidential treatment of all
information pertaining to these wells.

Sincerely,

ey T

Ellis M. Peterson
Senior Production Engineer
Wolverine Gas and Oil

RECEIVED
FEB 08 2008

! [T
E Uuverd he g e WD e

Y
PV

One Riverfront Plaza + 55 Campau, NW. + Grand Rapids, MI 49503-2616 « 616.458.1150 « FAX 616.458.0869



STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU-73528

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly despen existing wells beiow current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

NA

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Wolverine Federal Unit

1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

OlL WELL GASWELL L]~ OTHER Wolverine Federal 17-8
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC 4304130047
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND PQOOL, OR WILDCAT:
55 Campau NW oy Grand Rapids srare Ml ,,49503-2616] (616) 458-1150 Covenant Field, Navajo

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FooTAces AT sUrRFace: 2020' FSL and 1602' FWL

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NESW

17 238 01W S

countY: Sevier

STATE:
UTAH

1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

O

NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate)

Approximate date work will start:

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit Original Form Only)

Date of work completion:

] acibize

ALTER CASING

CASING REPAIR

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS
CHANGE TUBING

CHANGE WELL NAME

CHANGE WELL STATUS

Oooooon

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS

[C] cONVERT WELL TYPE

[J oeepen

[[] eracture TREaT
NEW CONSTRUCTION
OPERATOR CHANGE
PLUG AND ABANDON
PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION (START/RESUME)

OOoonon

RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE

[[] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
TEMPORARILY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR

VENT OR FLARE

WATER DISPOSAL

WATER SHUT-OFF

other: Activity Update

NOOOOooo

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

A compietion unit rigged up on the Wolverine Federal 17-8 on 1/18/08 and completion activities are currently in progress.

Ellis M. Peterson

Senior Production Engineer

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) TITLE
SIGNATURE DATE 1 /29/ 2008
{This space for State use only) R EC E IVE D

(6/2000)

(See Instructions on Reverse Side)

FEB 08 2008
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



NOTICE
Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-21 states that,

> A well is considered completed when the well has been adequately worked to be capable
of producing oil or gas or when well testing as required by the division is concluded.

> Within 30 days after the completion or plugging of a well, the following shall be filed:
» Form 8, Well Completion or Recompletion Report and Log

A copy of electric and radioactivity logs, if run

» A copy of drillstem test reports,

A copy of formation water analyses, porosity, permeability or fluid saturation
determinations

A copy of core analyses, and lithologic logs or sample descriptions if compiled

A copy of directional, deviation, and/or measurement-while-drilling survey for
each horizontal well

Failure to submit reports in a timely manner will result in the issuance of a Notice of Violation
by the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, and may result in the Division pursuing enforcement
action as outlined in Rule R649-10, Administrative Procedures, and Section 40-6-11 of the
Utah Code.

As of the mailing of this notice, the division has not received the required reports for

Operator; _Wolverine Gas & Oil Co UT Today’s Date: 02/14/2008
Well: APl Number: Drilling Commenced:
Wolverine Fed 17-8 drlg rpts/wcer 4304130047 06/16/2007
Wolverine Fed 17-9 drlg rpts/wcer 4304130049 06/16/2007
Wov Fed Arapien Vly 24-1 drlg rpts/wecr 4303930030 10/03/2007

223 w17

To avoid compliance action, required reports should be mailed within 7 business days to:
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801
If you have questions or concerns regarding this matter, please call (801) 538-5284.

cc: Well File
Compliance File



WOLVERINE GAS AND OIL COMPANY
OF UTAH, LLC

Energy Exploration in Partnership with the Environment

February 15, 2008

LORFIDENTIN

Al McKee

BLM Utah State Office

PO Box 45155

Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155
United States of America

RE: Sundry Notices - Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC
Wolverine Federal 17-8, API 43-041-30047
Wolverine Federal 17-9, API 43-041-30049
Covenant Field, Sevier County, Utah

Dear Mr. McKee:

Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC (Wolverine) respectfully submits the
enclosed Sundry Notices in triplicate for the two referenced wells.

Please accept this letter as Wolverine’s written request for confidential treatment of all
information contained in and pertaining to these notices.

Please advise if you have any questions or need additional information.
Sincerely, ,

Ellis M. Peterson

Senior Production Engineer F’ RECE“’ED
Wolverine Gas and Oil ~ FEB 19 2008
DIV, OF OlL, GAS & MINING

cc:  UDOGM w/ attachments in duplicate

coPY

One Riverfront Plaza » 55 Campau, NW. + Grand Rapids, MI 49503-2616 .CGNF{JE};ENTmtaﬁ&om



Form 3160-5

Foa 2160 UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

LoirIDENTIAL

FORM APPROVED
OMB No. 10040137
Expires: March 31, 2007
5. Lease Serial No.
UTU-73528

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side.

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

Wolverine Unit

1. Type of Well

OilwellOO D GasWellOD

] Other

8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator w1 erine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC

Wolverine Federal 17-8
9. API Well No.

3a Address

55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI 49503 616-458-1150

3b. Phone No. (include area code}

4304130047
10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., I., R, M, or Survey Description)
2020" FSL, 1602' FWL, Sec. 17, T23S, R1W, SLB&M

Covenant Field, Navajo
11. County or Parish, State

Sevier County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[ Acidize [ Deepen [ production (StartResume) LI Wter Stut-Off
[ Iotice of totent (] Atter Casing L] Fracture Trear Reclamation Well Integrity
[¥] Subsequent Report [l Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other
Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon
[ JFinal AbendommentNotice | [T convertto Ijection L] Prug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

The Navajo 2 in this well was perforated at 8360' - 8370' and 8210’ - 8220" with 6 SPF and swab tested to verify that the reservoir produces only
water. The perforations were abandoned by setting a CICR at 8200' and cementing with 25 sacks (5.12 barrels) of Class "G" cement.
Approximately 4.12 barrels of cement were pumped below the CICR and 1.0 barrel of cement was dumped on top of the CICR. The top of the

cement plug was tagged at 8130’ by wireline.

RECEIVED
© FEB 1Y 200

o, OF OIL, GAS & MINING

b

14. 1 hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Ellis Peterson

Title Sr. Production Engineer

Date

swsy T e

02/15/2008

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Appovedby e

Title

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease

which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Office

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make ita crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to anymatter within

its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)

CONFIDENTIAL

COPY



Fom 31605

(April 2004) UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an
abandoned well. Use Form 3160 -3 (APD) for such proposals.

P “"‘.v ’:», ‘ I
Luir e A i

FORM APPROVED
OMB No. 10040137
Expires: March 31, 2007
5. Lease Serial No.
UTU-73528

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side.

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well
P [/]0iWellDD  []GasWellDD  [] Other

Wolverine Unit

8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC

Wolverine Federal 17-8
9. API Well No.

3a Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code)
55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI 49503 616-458-1150

4304130047
10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R, M., or Survey Description)
2020' FSL, 1602' FWL, Sec. 17, T23S, R1W, SLB&M

Covenant Field, Navajo
11. County or Parish, State

Sevier County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
T Acidize [ peepen [/ ] production (StartResume) LI Weter Shut-OFf
[ Iotice of Intent (] Atter Casing [ Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Lntegrity
Subsequent Report [ Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other
Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon
[ ] Final Abandonment Notce | [ cnyert o njecion Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, 2 Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the site is ready for final inspection. )

Oil production in saleable quantities was initiated during completion operations in the Twin Creek Formation in this well on February 14, 2008.

Oil gravity was 37 degrees API at 60 degrees F per field measurement.

RECEIVED
FEB 19 2008

Di¥-OFEOlL, GAS & MINING.

14. Thereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Ellis Peterson

Title Sr. Production Engineer

sonr A o oo

02/15/2008

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approvedby _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ o ___ Title

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease | Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make ita crime for any person knowingly and willfally tomaketo any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to anymatter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)

CONFIDENTIAL

cOPY



WOLVERINE GAS AND OIL COMPANY
OF UTAH, LLC

Energy Exploration in Partnership with the Environment

March 26, 2008

Mr. Gil Hunt

Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
P.O. Box 145801

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Re:  Reporting Forms - Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC
Wolverine Federal 17-8 (UDOGM Sundry Notice)
Wolverine State Twist Canyon 16-1 (UDOGM Sundry Notice)
Wolverine Federal 17-5 (BLM Sundry Notice)

Dear Mr. Hunt:

Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC respectfully submits the enclosed Sundry
Notices (Form 9) in duplicate for the Wolverine Federal 17-8 and Wolverine State Twist
Canyon HEA copy of a BLM Sundry Notice for a recompletion workover performed on
the Wolverine Federal 17-5 is also enclosed.

Please accept this letter as Wolverine’s written request for confidential treatment of all
information pertaining to these wells.

Sincerely,

=3

Ellis M. Peterson
Senior Production Engineer
Wolverine Gas and Oil

"” RECEIVED
" APRO{ 263
DIV.OF OIL, GAS & wisyyc

One Riverfront Plaza * 55 Campau, NW. < Grand Rapids, MI 49503-2616 + 616.458.1150 + FAX 616.458.0869



STATE OF UTAN - CONFIDENTIAL  romno

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING ' 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-73528

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS NA

. ) . - 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. Wolverine Federal Unit

1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL T . ’
¥4 [1 otHer Wolverine Federal 17-8

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:! 9. API NUMBER:
Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC 4304130047
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: ‘ PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WIiLDCAT:
55 Campau NW oy Grand Rapids state Ml ,,49503-2616] (616) 458-1150 Covenant Field, Navajo
4. LOCATION OF WELL
rooTAces AT surFace: 2020' FSL and 1602' FWL county: Sevier
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NESW 17 23S 01W S STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

] Acioize [] oeeren [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

[ NoTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ] ALtERCASING [] FRACTURE TREAT [[] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start; D CASING REPAIR |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION |___| TEMPORARILY ABANDON

] CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [ oreraTOR cHANGE ] TusiNGREPAIR
7] cHance TUBING [] PLuG AND ABANDON ] venToRFLARE

[/l suBSEQUENT REPORT ] cHanGe wELL NAME [J pwesack [[] water bisPosAL

{Submit Original Form Only)
[[] CHANGE WELL STATUS [] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) ] waTer sHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

[T] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE /] orrer Activity Update
[C] converT weLL TYPE [[] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Twin Creek Formation perforations at 7996' - 8008, 8050' - 8070', and 8088' - 8108' were flow tested untii high volume water
production eventually caused the well to quit flowing. On 3/25/08 a completion unit was moved to swab test and determine the
source of the water, possibly cement squeeze water producing intervals, add additional perforations at 8014’ - 8026', and run
pumping equipment. The well is expected to be completed for production following this work.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Ellis M. Peterson e Senior Production Engineer

SlGNATUR%;W e 3/26/2008

{This space for State use only)

¢ RECEIVED
- APR 01 2008
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)



uposmn

Form 3160-4 UNITED STATES ﬂ P E' D EM ik
(April 2009 DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ¥ W hif * Hid FORM APPROVED
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: M'arch 31,2007
WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG 5 Leoss Seral e,
UTU-73528
la. Typeof Well [V]oil Well []Gas Well [IDry [JOther 6. If Indian, Allotfee o Tribe Name
b. Type of Completion: [/INewWell [ JWork Over [ JDeepen [ ]PlugBack [ _]Diff. Resvr,. N.A.
Other 7 Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.
Wolverine Federal Unit
2 Name of Operator g 1yerine Gas and Ot Co. of Utah, LLC % Loass Name od Well o
Wolverine Federal 17-8
3. Address 55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI 49503 3a Phone No. (include avea code) 9. AFI Well No.
616-458-1150 4304130047
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements)* 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
At surf Covenant Field, Twin Creek
surrace
2020 FSL, 1602' FWL, Sec. 17, T23S, RIW 1L S T.RLM. = B%%%lé a% y
. 7, T238, RIW,
At top prod. interval reporied below  2920' FSL, 1602' FWL, Sec, 17, T238, RIW Survey or Area e o Bt
12 County or Parish |13 State
Attotal depth  2020" FSL, 1620' FWL, Sec. 17, T23S, RIW Sevier T
14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16. Date Completed  ¢4/08/2008 17, Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)*
06/16/2007 09/07/2007 [Ip&A  [V]Ready to Prod. 5819' KB, 5793' GL
I8. Total Depth: MD 13760’ 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 813" 20. Depth Bridge Plug Set:  MD 8200
TVD 13760 TVD g13¢' VD 8200"

2L TypeElectric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy of each)

Die, MSFL DL ;50 DSH w3 LD, HRY Rk
L |

22 Waswell cored? [ JNo |_Yes (Submit aualysis)
Was DST run?

Directional Survey? [/INo [_]Yes (Submit copy)

[/ Ivo []¥es (Submit report)

B, Casing and Liner Record (Report all Strings set in wel) D O, oA

Hole Size | Size/Grade | Wt.(#ft) | Top(MD) | Bottom (MD) Stagg;;‘f“‘“ ,g > °§f Sggmgg . Slu(ngX)oL Cement Top* Amount Pulled

30.0" 20" 0.25 wall | Surface 115 redi-mix 67 Surface

17.5" 13.375J | 68.0 Surface 1915 352 CBM 271 Surf. (CIR)

" n " 470 Type V 100

12.25" 9.625 P 47.0 Surface 6985 5671 570 50:50 Poz | 128 1100 (TS)

" " " 5671 170C+805G | 315

8.5" 5.500 L 20.0 Surface 9524 6816 42550:50 Poz | 136 6816 (CIR)
24 Tubing Record

Size Depth Set (MD)| Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) |Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) | Packer Depth (MD)
23/8 8058 8036 2-718 7956 7956
25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record
Formation Top Bottor Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf, Status

A) Navajo 8360 8370 8360 - 8370 0.40" 60 Plugged

B) Navajo 8210 8220 8210 - 8220 0.40" 60 Plugged

C)  Twin Creek 7996 8108 7996 - 8108 0.40" 256 Open - Producing
D

27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, etc.

Depth Interval Amount and Type of Material
8210 - 8370 Perforations were squeeze cemented with 5.1 Bbls of Class "G" cement through a cement retainer at 8200,

28. Production - Interval A

Date First | Test Hours Test il Gas Water Ol Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced | Date Tested Production | BBL MCF BBL Com. AP Gravity

02/08/2008 | 7.5 "") 0 0 218 Swabbiag
Choke Thg. Press. | Csg. 24Hr. 0il Gas Water Gas/Oll Well Status
Size Fiwg, Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

S -—-)

28a. Production - Interval B

Date First | Test Hours Test il Gas Water Qil Gravity Gas | Production Method
Produced | Date Tested | Producion | BBL MCF BBL Corr. APl Gravity

02/05/2008 { 10 0 0 363 Swabbing
Choke Thg. Press.| Csg. 24Hr. gg L Gas l\;JBatiar %Sﬁ/Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate MCF 0

s > RECEIVED

*(See instructions and spaces for additional data on page 2)

APR 2 4 2008
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



28b. Production - Interval C

Date First | Test Hours Test 0il Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced | Date Tested Production | BB MCF BBL Cor. APL Gravity
02/14/2008 | 04/10/2008 | 24 —> 170 Tr 352 39 Temporary Hydraulic Pump
Choke | Tbg. Press. | Csg. 24 Hr. 0il Gas Water Gas/Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio
S -» 170 Tr 352 Producing Oil Well
28¢. Production - Interval D
Date First | Test Hours Test 0il Gas Water 0il Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced | Date Tested [ Production | BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity
Choke | Thg.Press.{ Csg. 24Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas/Oll Well Stars
Size Flwg, Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio
St
29. Disposition of Gas (Sold, used for fuel, vented, etc,)
Vented
30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem
tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures

and recoveries.
. - To
Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name Meas. Depth
Navajo 2 8206 9470 Water Arapien Surface
Twin Creek 2 7876 8206 Water and Oil Twin Creek 1 5614
Wingate 1 7227 7644 Water Navajo 1 5912
Kayenta 1 7088 7227 Water Chinle 1 7644
Navajo 1 5912 7088 Water and Oil Twin Creek 2 7876
Navajo 2 8206
Chinle 2 9998
Moenkopi 10476
Sinbad 12116
Black Dragon 12503
Kaibab 12973
Toroweap 13350

32. Additional remarks (include plugging procedure):

Cement Plugs were set at 12,700' - 12,910" and 9850’ - 10,150’ before running 5-1/2" production casing. Navajo 2 perforations at 8360' - 8370' and
8210' - 8220" were cemented with 25 sacks (5.12 barrels) of Class "G" through a CICR at 8200". The top of the cement plug was wireline tagged
at 8130' as the current PBTD.

33. Indicate which itmes have been attached by placing a check in the appropriate boxes:

Electrical/Mechanical Logs (1 full set req'd.) GeologicReport [ ]DST Report [ Directional Survey
[7] Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification [ Core Analysis [ Other:

34. Thereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

Name (please pring) Eilis Peterson Tide Sr. Production Engineer

~

Title 18 US.C Section 1001 and Title 43 US.C Section 1212, make it a crime for any person kaowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matier within its jurisdiction.

(Form 31604, page 2)



WOLVERINE GAS AND OIL COMPANY
OF UTAH, LLC

Energy Exploration in Partnership with the Environment

June 20, 2008

Mr. Stan Andersen

Fluid Minerals Group
Bureau of Land Management
Richfield Field Office

150 East 900 North
Richfield, Utah 84701

Re:  Sundry Notice - Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC
Wolverine Federal 17-8

Dear Mr. Andersen:

Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC respectfully submits the enclosed Sundry
Notice (Form 3160-5) for the Wolverine Federal 17-8 located in the Covenant Field.

Please accept this letter as Wolverine’s written request for continued confidential

treatment of all information relating to this well.

Sincerely,

Ellis M. Peterson
Senior Production Engineer
Wolverine Gas and Oil

RECEIVED
JUN 26 2008
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING

cc: Gil Hunt, UDOGM

One Riverfront Plaza » 55 Campau, NW. <« Grand Rapids, MI 49503-2616 « 616.458.1150 s FAX 616.458.0869



Form 3160-5
(April 2004)

UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6.

CONFIDENTIAL

FORM APPROVED
OM B No. 10040137
Expires; March 31, 2007

5. Lease Sertal No.
UTU-73528

If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side.

7. 1f Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

Wolverine Unit

1. Type of Well
YP ou Wellno  []GasWellon [ Other T I
Wolverine Federal 17-8
2. Name of Operalor w10 erine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC S APTWaING
3a Address 3b. Phone No. (include area cocle) 4304130047

55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI 49503

616-458-1150 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R, M., or Suivey Description)
2020' FSL, 1602' FWL, Sec. 17, T23S, R1W, SLB&M

Covenant Field, Navajo
11. County or Parish, State

Sevier County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
. D Acidize D Deepen 1 Production (Start/Resume) DWater Stut-Off
Notice of Intent Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity
D Subsequent Report [:I Casing Repair New Counstruction Recomplete Other
D . ) D Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon
Final Abandonment Nofice D Convert to Injection l:l Plug Back D Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.

Ifthe proposal is to degpen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

The Twin Creek?2 is currently being produced in this well from perforations at 7996'- 8108". It is planned to temporarily plug back the Twin
Creek 2 producing interval using a retrivable bridge plug, back off or cut the 5-1/2" casing at approximately 6600', and then remove the 5-1/2"
from the back-off depth to surface. After removal of the 5-1/2" casing, the Navajol will be completed by perforating the exposed 9-5/8" casing

in five selected perforation intervals at depths from 6178 to 6334' and the well will be placed on production from the Navajol.

The planned completion activities on this 2007 Covenant Field well are expected to resume on June 29, 2008 and have a duration of

approximately 35 days.

RECEIVED

COPY SENT TO OPERATOR
Initiale:___JE5 DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING

14. Thereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Ellis Peterson

Title Sr. Preduction Engineer

oo Bt

Date

06/20/2008

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Federal Approval Of This

Approvedby
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease

which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Fonnpon U‘,’ &7  Actionis Necessary

Date

Title 18 US.C. Section 1001 and Title43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make ita crime for any person
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representanons a to anymatter w1thm ts j

{Instructions on page 2)




Fom 3160-5 UNITED STATES
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

CONFIDENTIAL

FORM APPROVED
OMB No. 10040137
Expires: March 31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.
UTU-73528

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side.

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Wel]
yP OiIWeHDD []Gaswello []Other

Wolverine Unit

8. Well Name and No.

Wolverine Federal 17-8

9. APl Well No.

2. Name of Operator Waolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC
3a Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code)
55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI 49503 616-458-1150

4304130047

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R, M, or Survey Description)
2020" FSL, 1602' FWL, Sec. 17, T23S, R1W, SLB&M

Covenant Field, Navajo

11. County or Parish, State

Sevier County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE,

REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
. ] Acidize L] Deepen L] Production (Start/Resume) [ Jwater Shut-Off
Notice of Intent D Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity
[ subsequ tR Casing Repair L] New Construction DRecom lete Other
ubsequent Report p!
I___I _ _ D Change Plans D Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon
Final Abandonment Notice I:I Convert to [njection D Plug Back D Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shalt be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Work was in progress to remove 5-1/2" casing prior to completing the Navajol in this well when it was discovered that the 9-5/8" had collapsed
with the most severe deformation in an interval at 5570' - 5590". It is now planned and work is in progress to swage the 9-5/8" casing out as
needed to run 5-1/2" 20# N-80 casing from the cut-off depth of 6580’ back to surface and cement it in place. After successfully repairing the
casing, work to complete the Navajo 1 at depths from 6178' to 6334" will proceed as previously approved but through the two concentric casing

strings. A procedure with details of the planned repair work is included herewith.

Workover activities on this 2007 Covenant Field well are currently in progress. The casing repair is expected to take up to 10 days and then the

Navajol completion work will have duration of approximately four weeks.
COPY SENT TO OFERATOR

Date: G & 2008
Initials: %

RECEIVED
AUG 12 2008
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING

14. Thereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Elis Peterson Title Sr. Production Engineer

' N

08/06/2008

ol .

et Federal Approval Of This
Approvedby o _ ,T.lt!y = e, |Date” ” Necessar—
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or  [©I il XD TV 101 14ITHDN g AClioITsT

hind

which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. LR

1

certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lggse _Ofﬁc%/ { ’Z [ O SS
)y gad ilfdly]

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make ita crime for anﬁﬁsop knoyin;
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any mattér-aith

M to department or agency of the United

Y At

7

.

(Instructions on page 2)



Wolverine Gas & Oil Company of Utah, LLC
Procedure to Repair Collapsed Casing

Wolverine Federal 17-8
Covenant Field

Purpose: Procedure to swage out collapsed 9-5/8” casing and then run and cement 5-1/2”
casing in preparation for completing the Navajo.
PERTINENT INFORMATION
Location: 2020’ FSL, 1602” FWL (NE-SW)
Section 17, Township 23 South, Range 1 West
Sevier County, Utah
Elevation: 5793 GL, 5819° KB
TD: 13,760’
PBTD: 8130’ (cement above CICR @ 8200°), Arrowset 1 packer with H-valve top at 7100’
w/ 2 sacks of sand on top.
API No.: 43-041-30047
Casing: 13-3/8”, 68.0# @ 1915°, cemented to surface
9-5/8”, 47.0#, HCP-110, LT&C @ 6985°, cemented with 570 sks 50:50 Poz and 805
sks Class ‘G’ '
5-1/27, 20.0#, L-80, LT&C @ 9524°, Weatherford Pack-Off Stage Tool (POST) at
6816, cemented with 425 sks 50:50 Poz. Casing was cut off at 6580 KB
using a hydraulic mechanical casing cutter.
Wellhead: Tubing Head Flange: Currently 11” 5k
Tubing: 2-7/8”, 6.5#, L-80, EUE, 8rd (has been laid down)
Int./Prod.Casing Specs: 9-5/8”, 47.0#, HCP-110, LT&C, 8rd, ID: 8.681” Drift: 8.525”
Collapse: 7060 psi Burst: 7552 psi (80% 9440 psi)
Production Casing Specs: 5-1/27,20.0#, L-80, LT&C, 8rd, ID: 4.778” Drift: 4.653”
Collapse: 8830 psi Burst: 7352 psi (80% 9190 psi)
Tubing Specs: 2-7/8”, 6.5#, L-80, EUE, 8rd, ID: 2.441” Drift: 2.347”
Collapse: 11,170 psi ~ Burst: 10,570 psi (80% 8456 psi)
Joint: 145,000 1bs (80% 116,000 Ibs)
Capacities: 5-1/27, 20.0#: 0.0222 Bbls/ft, 0.1245 ft'/ft
2-7/8”, 6.5#: 0.00579 Bbls/ft, 0.0325 ft'/ft
5-1/2” x 2-7/8” Annulus: 0.0141 Bbls/ft, 0.0794 ft*/ft
9-5/8”, 47.0#: 0.0732 Bbls/ft, 0.4110 ft'/ft
9-5/8” x 2-7/8” Annulus: 0.0652 Bbls/ft, 0.3660 ft*/ft

BH Temperature: 185°F @ 6200° TVD



Page 2
Wolverine Federal 17-8 Casing Repair Procedure
July 31, 2008

Current Twin Creek 2 Perforations:

7996' - 8008' MD (7996' — 8008' TVD), 12', 48 holes
8014' - 8026' MD (8014' — 8026' TVD), 12', 48 holes
8050' - 8070' MD (8050' — 8070' TVD), 20', 80 holes
8088’ - 8108' MD (8088' — 8108’ TVD), 20", 80 holes

Future Navajol completion interval: 5914°- 6334’ MD
All depths are referenced to Halliburton SDL-DSN-GR log dated 7/23/07.

Note: During completion activities, 5-1/2” casing was cut at 6580’ and pulled in anticipation of
completing the Navajol in the 9-5/8” casing. It was discovered that the 9-5/8” casing was severely
salt collapsed at approximately 5600°. A rig is on the well and this procedure outlines plans for
swaging the 9-5/8” casing out, running and cementing 5-1/2” casing in place, and cleaning out the 5-
1/2” casing in preparation for completing the Navajol through the 5-1/2” and 9-5/8” casing strings.

PROCEDURE

1. Assure that well is filled to surface with completion fluid. Rig up Weatherford wireline.
Run a 3-5/8” OD 40-arm MSC log across collapsed casing interval from 5620’ to 5450’
with three passes. RIH with a 3-1/8” perforating gun loaded with eight 11-gram loads on
90° phasing. Ease perforating gun into 5-1/2” casing stubbed at 6580°, get on depth to
Schlumberger CBL (dated 23-Jan-2008) in 5-1/2”, and perforate the casing with top shot
at 6630’. Tag top of sand at ~7080° to verify depth and POOH with wireline. RD and
release Weatherford wireline.

Note: 24-hour operations will start when swaging activities begin. Weatherford is providing
equipment and personnel to supervise the swaging operation. Assuming casing deformation has
not worsened since the last caliper run, start swaging with a 5.50” swage and plan to increase
swage size in 0.125” to 0.25” increments on subsequent runs. On each swage run, after swaging
down and pulling up, wait 30 minutes above swaged interval and then run the swage back
through before tripping for the next swage. It is anticipated that the worst collapsed interval at
~5580” can be swaged out to a minimum of 6.0” and it is desired to swage out to 6.5”. The
weight it takes to swage and pull out is to be monitored and communicated, and that information
will be used for the basis of determining when swaging is discontinued.

2. Change out BOP rams for 3-1/2” DP. PU and RIH with a swage, one 4-3/4” DC, safety
joint, lubricated bumper sub, 4-3/4” hydraulic drilling jar, four 4-3/4” DC, 4-3/4” slinger,
and seven 4-3/4” DC on 3-1/2” drill pipe. '

3. Swage out collapsed casing at approximately 5576 — 5585 with initial swage sized per
the Weatherford Fisherman’s recommendation and following the guidelines above.
Continue swaging until the casing is out to desired diameter (6.5”) or until advised by
Wolverine Management to discontinue swaging.

4. After swaging out to final diameter, wait with tools hanging above collapsed spot for a
minimum of 12 hours and then check to see if swage goes through collapse area. POOH
with tools.
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10.

11.

12.

13.
14.

RIH with a 6” lead impression block, 950° of DP, one 5-5/8” or 6.25” DC (depending on
last swage size), one 4-3/4” DC, safety joint, lubricated bumper sub, 4-3/4” hydraulic
drilling jar, four 4-3/4” DC, 4-3/4” slinger, and seven 4-3/4” DC on 3-1/2” drill pipe. Set
down on 5-1/2” casing stub to get imprint on IB, and the DC will verify that 5-1/2” casing
can be run through the swaged casing. POOH and lay down DP and tools.

RU casing crew and RIH with 5-1/2” casing as outlined on the casing tally sheet (to be
provided after casing is received and tallied). If 9-5/8” casing was swaged to 6.257+, the
casing will include a cut-off end-joint, 23 joints (~930) of 20# N-80 LTC, 7 joints (~280°)
of 20# HCP-110 LTC, and ~130 joints (~5340°) of 20# N-80 LTC to surface. If 9-5/8”
casing was swaged to <6.25”, the cut-off joint and bottom 23 full Jjoints will be 20# L-80
Ultraflush-joint with a cross-over to the 20# HCP-110 LTC casing. It is planned to run six
slim-hole casing centralizers on lock rings at depths (to be specified on tally sheet) below
and at the collapse depth and 11 regular bow-spring centralizers will be spaced out from
~5460° to ~4140°. Lightly tag bottom with casing and then pick up to the free-pipe
hanging weight and land casing in slips (without putting weight on bottom).

Change out BOP rams for tubing. PU and run inside the 5-1/2” to check drift with a 4-
5/8” swage, a ~20° 3-1/2” drill collar, 4-5/8” string mill, 3-3/4” fishing jars, and six 3-
1/2” DC on 2-7/8” tubing. Round trip assembly to 6580°.

RIH to ~6560° with a Halliburton casing alignment tool (20’ long) attached to a 5-1/2”
(20#) cement retainer and stinger on 2-7/8” tubing.

RU wireline service and run a GR-CCL inside the tubing and correlate depth to the
Halliburton SDL-DSN-GR log (23-Jul-2007). RD wireline.

Lower the tubing so the alignment tool straddles (10" above and below) where the 5-1/2”
casing ends meet at 6587° (Halliburton SDL-DSN-GR log depth), and set the cement
retainer (at ~ 6576°).

RU Halliburton cementing service. Install choke or valve in return line from 9-5/8” casing
to hold back pressure as needed during cementing. Pressure test surface lines and tubing
to 2500 psi. Shear out of cement retainer with stinger and then sting back into retainer.
Establish circulation down tubing and up 5-1/2” x 9-5/8” annulus with fresh water at 2
BPM.

Pump 160 Bbls of fresh water containing 70 gallons (1%) of Baker Petrolite CRW132
(biocide, Oxygen Scavenger, and Corrosion Inhibitor), 5 Bbls of fresh water spacer, and
139 Bbls (660 sacks) of cement slurry at 2 BPM. Cement is to be premium Class “G”
containing Halliburton recommended additives mixed to 15.8 ppg weight, 1.186 ft3/sk
yield, and 5.13 gal/sk mix water. Displace cement with 37 Bbls of water and then unsting
to dump 1 Bbl of cement on top of cement retainer. Pull up one joint and reverse circulate
tubing clean with 70 Bbls of water. RD cementing service and POOH with tubing and
stinger.

Shut down for 24+ hours to wait on cement and then return to day light operations.

Latch casing, pull 50,000 1bs tension, and land casing in slips. Cut casing, ND BOP, and
ND tubing head and DSA. Make final casing cut and install DSA and 7-1/16” 5k tubing
head. NU BOP.
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15. RIH with a 4-5/8” medium-tooth rock bit, and six 3-1/2” DC on 2-7/8" tubing. R{ power
swivel and drill out cement, cement retainer, and alignment tool. Circulate clean and
POOH.

16.  RIH with a 4-3/4” tapered mill, a short (~10°) 3-1/2” drill collar, 4-3/4” string mill, 3-3/4”
fishing jars, and six 3-1/2” DC on 2-7/8” tubing. Work through the area where the 5-1/2”
casing was tied together as necessary to assure tools can be smoothly run. Continue to top
of sand at ~7080’, reverse circulate clean with completion fluid, and POOH with tubing
and tools.

17. Proceed to complete Lower Navajol in the 5-1/2” casing as will be outlined in a
subsequently distributed procedure.

Contacts:
Weatherford Wireline: Ron Wells, 435-781-1868 (office), 435-828-8479 (cell)
Weatherford Fisherman:  Jim Hoffman, 970-242-3845 (home), 970-778-2978 (cell)
Halliburton Tools: Randy Ripple, 435-781-7532 (office), 435-828-1610 (cell)
Halliburton Cementing: Corey Reynolds, 435-781-5539 (office)

Weston Spencer, 435-781-5540 (office)

Main Dispatch, 435-789-2550
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P biwelnn  [Jaswetn [ Otter

Wolverine Unit

8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC

Wolverine Federal 17-8
9. API Well No.

32 Address
55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI 49503

3b. Phone No. (include area code)
616-458-1150

4304130047
10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R., M., or Survey Description)
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Wolverine Gas & Oil Company of Utah, LL.C
Completion Procedure

Wolverine Federal 17-8
Covenant Field

Purpose: Update original procedure to complete the Navajol after running, cementing, and
drilling out 5-1/2” casing (inside existing 9-5/8”).
PERTINENT INFORMATION

Location: 2020’ FSL, 1602’ FWL (NE-SW)
Section 17, Township 23 South, Range 1 West
Sevier County, Utah

Elevation: 5793’ GL, 5819’ KB

TD: 13,760’
PBTD: 7080 (Arrowset 1 packer with “H” valve @ 7100 and 2 sacks of sand on top)
API No.: 43-041-30047
Casing: 13-3/87, 68.0# (@ 1915°, cemented to surface ,
9-5/8”, 47.0#, HCP-110, LT&C @ 6985°, cemented with 570 sks 50:50 Poz and 805
sks Class ‘G’

5-1/27,20.0#, L-80, UFJ and LT&C @ 9524°, Weatherford Pack-Off Stage Tool
(POST) at 6816°, originally cemented with 425 sks 50:50 Poz. Squeeze
perforations at 6630°- 6632’, casing cut and realigned at 6580°, and
cemented in 9-5/8” from 6632’ to ~3500° with 660 sacks of Premium Class

‘CG’!
Wellhead: Tubing Head Flange — 7-1/16” 5k w/ 2-7/8” EUE top connection
Tubing: 2-7/8”, 6.5#, L-80, EUE, 8rd
Production Casing Specs: 5-1/27, 20.0#, L-80, LT&C, 8rd, ID: 4.778” Drift: 4.653”
Collapse: 8830 psi Burst: 7352 psi (80% 9190 psi)
Tubing Specs: 2-7/8”, 6.5#, L-80, EUE, 8rd, ID: 2.441” Drift: 2.347”
Collapse: 11,170 psi ~ Burst: 10,570 psi (80% 8456 psi)
Joint: 145,000 1bs (80% 116,000 1bs)
Capacities: 5-1/27, 20.0#: 0.0222 Bbls/ft, 0.1245 ft*/ft
2-7/8”, 6.5#: 0.00579 Bbls/ft, 0.0325 ft*/ft
5-1/2” x 2-7/8” Annulus: 0.0141 Bbls/ft, 0.0794 ft*/ft

BH Temperature: 185°F @ 6200° TVD
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Wolverine Federal 17-8 Completion Procedure
August 18, 2008

Twin Creek 2 Perforations:

7996' - 8008' MD (7996' — 8008' TVD), 12', 48 holes
8014' - 8026' MD (8014' ~ 8026' TVD), 12', 48 holes
8050" - 8070' MD (8050' — 8070" TVD), 20", 80 holes
8088' - 8108' MD (8088' — 8108' TVD), 20", 80 holes

Proposed Lower Navajol Perforations:

6178’- 6188> MD (6178’- 6188’ TVD), 10°, 60 holes
6202°- 6222° MD (6202’- 6222° TVD), 20°, 120 holes
6240°- 6260° MD (6240°- 6260° TVD), 20, 120 holes
6276’- 6291’ MD (6276’- 6291° TVD), 15°, 90 holes
6311°- 6334° MD (6311°- 6334’ TVD), 23°, 138 holes

Note: All depths are referenced to Halliburton SDL-DSN-GR log dated 7/23/07.

PROCEDURE

Note: Rig is on well with BOPE and tanks filled with completion fluid in place.

L.
2.

RIH with 2-7/8” tubing and barred collar (or seating nipple) for no-go to ~7070°.

RU service company. Clean tubing and casing by reverse circulating the following in
order (or per service company recommendation): 1000 gallons of CF, 685 gallons of
caustic solution, 685 gallons of chemical wash (containing mutual solvent with
surfactant), 685 gallons of gelled spacer (with buffering agents), 685 gallons of fresh
water, 685 gallons of 7-1/2% HCI acid (with inhibitor), and 685 gallons of fresh water.
Displace with 37 Bbls of CF followed by 15 Bbls of 9+ ppg salt water containing 6
gallons (1%) of Baker Petrolite CRW132 and then 89 Bbls of CF. RD service company.

POOH with tubing.

RU wireline unit. Run a radial CBL-GR-CCL with cement mapping from PBTD (~7080")
to top of cement (~3500”). Make an initial pass from PBTD to 5900’ with no pressure and
then log from PBTD to TOC with maximum pressure permitted by wireline equipment up
to 3000 psi. RD wireline unit.

RIH with tubing to ~4000°. RU and swab fluid level in well down to 2500°. RD swab and
POOH with tubing.

RU wireline. Perforate the bottom completion interval at 6311' - 6334' WLM with 0.40+”
diameter holes using 4” hollow carriers loaded 6 SPF on 60° phasing with 24+ gram
charges. RD and release wireline unit.

RIH with a 5-1/2” (20#) RBP, retrieving head, pup joint, 5-1/2” (20#) stimulation packer,
seating nipple, and 2-7/8” tubing. Set RBP at ~6360 and packer at ~6250° in 20,000 lbs
compression. RU and swab for rate and clean up. If swab rates indicate perforation
breakdown is not needed, skip to step 10.

RU to break down and ball off the isolated perforation interval using 2000 gallons of
completion fluid mixed with 5 gpt Halliburton GasPerm 1000 and 200 mixed ball sealers
(half BioBalls and half buoyant balls) as follows.
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10.

11.

12.

13.

Fluids and Additives:

Breakdown Fluid: 2000 gallons completion fluid (Wolverine provided) with added
5 gpt Halliburton GasPerm 1000.

Diverter: 200 Diverter Balls including 100 BioBalls MR (7/8”, green) and 100
7/8” 0.90 S.G. balls.

Displacement Fluid (CF): 40 Barrels

Maximum Injection Pressure: 5000 psi
Injection Rate: 2-5 BPM

Pump Schedule:
A. Pressure test surface lines to 5000+ psi.

B. Establish a rate into the isolated perforations with CF (no balls).
C. Open bypass on packer.

D. Pump 500 gallons (11.9 Bbls) of Breakdown Fluid (with no balls) at a rate of
1.5 BPM.

E. Pump 750 gallons (17.9 Bbls) of Breakdown Fluid containing 100 buoyant balls
(one per 7.5 gallons) at a rate of 1.5 BPM.

F. Pump 250 gallons (6.0 Bbls) of Breakdown Fluid containing 33 BioBalls (one
per 7.5 gallons) at a rate of 1.5 BPM.

G. Close bypass on packer.

H. Pump 500 gallons (11.9 Bbls) of Breakdown Fluid containing 67 BioBalls (one
per 7.5 gallons) at a rate of rate of 2-5 BPM and 4000 - 5000 psi.

L. Pump 1680 gallons (40 Bbls) of CF to displace Breakdown Fluid and balls at a
rate of 2-5 BPM and 4000 - 5000 psi.

J. Shut well in, record ISIP, and monitor pressure for 15 minutes.

Open well, make a couple of swab runs to release ball sealers, open bypass on packer, and
reverse circulate 40+ Bbls of CF at 1.5 BPM to recover buoyant balls. Close bypass on
packer and swab back for cleanup until load fluid is recovered and rate, fluid level, and
water-cut stabilize.

Release packer and RIH to RBP. Reverse circulate clean and move RBP to 6306 WLM.
Set packer and pressure test RBP to 2000 psi. Release packer and swab fluid level in
casing down to ~2500°. POOH with retrieving head, packer and tubing.

RU wireline company. Perforate intervals at 6276' - 6291' and 6240' - 6260' WLM with
0.40+” diameter holes using 4” hollow carriers loaded 6 SPF on 60° phasing with 24+
gram charges. RD and release wireline unit.

RIH with a retrieving head, pup joint, 5-1/2” (20#) stimulation packer, seating nipple, and
2-7/8” tubing. Set packer at ~6200” in 20,000 Ibs compression. RU and swab for rate and
clean up.

Release packer and reset it at 6266° WLM. RU and swab for rate and clean up.
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14.

15.

16.

17.

18.

If swab rates indicate perforation breakdown is not needed, skip to step 17. Otherwise,
move and set packer at ~6160°.

RU to break down and ball off the isolated perforation interval using 2500 gallons of
completion fluid mixed with 5 gpt Halliburton GasPerm 1000 and 300 mixed ball sealers
(half BioBalls and half buoyant balls) as follows.

Fluids and Additives:

Breakdown Fluid: 2500 gallons completion fluid (Wolverine provided) with added
5 gpt GasPerm 1000.

Diverter: 300 Diverter Balls including 150 BioBalls MR (7/8”, green) and 150
7/8” 0.90 S.G. balls.

Displacement Fluid (CF): 40 Barrels

Maximum Injection Pressure: 5000 psi
Injection Rate: 2-5 BPM

Pump Schedule:
A. Pressure test surface lines to 5000+ psi.

B. Establish a rate into the isolated perforations with CF (no balls).
" C. Open bypass on packer.
D

. Pump 500 gallons (11.9 Bbls) of Breakdown Fluid (with no balls) at a rate of
1.5 BPM.

E. Pump 1000 gallons (23.8 Bbls) of Breakdown Fluid containing 150 buoyant
balls (one per 6.67 gallons) at a rate of 1.5 BPM.

1'11

Close bypass on packer.

G. Pump 1000 gallons (23.8 Bbls) of Breakdown Fluid containing 150 BioBalls
(one per 6.67 gallons) at a rate of rate of 2-5 BPM and 4000 - 5000 psi.

H. Pump 1680 gallons (40 Bbls) of CF to displace Breakdown Fluid and balls at a
rate of 2-5 BPM and 4000 - 5000 psi.

1. Shut well in, record ISIP, and monitor pressure for 15 minutes.

Open well, make a couple of swab runs to release ball sealers, open bypass on packer, and
reverse circulate 40+ Bbls of CF at 1.5 BPM to recover buoyant balls. Close bypass on
packer and swab back for cleanup until load fluid is recovered and rate, fluid level, and
water-cut stabilize.

Release packer and RIH to RBP. Reverse circulate clean and move RBP to 6235 WLM.
Set packer and pressure test RBP to 2000 psi. Release packer and swab fluid level in
casing down to ~2500°. POOH with retrieving head, packer and tubing.

RU wireline company. Perforate intervals at 6202' - 6222' and 6178' - 6188' WLM with
0.40+” diameter holes using 4” hollow carriers loaded 6 SPF on 60° phasing with 24+
gram charges. RD and release wireline unit.
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19.

20.
21.

22.

23.

24.

RIH with a 5-1/2” (20#) stimulation packer (no tubing tail), seating nipple, and 2-7/8”
tubing. Set packer at ~6160” in 20,000 Ibs compression. RU and swab for rate and clean
up.

Release packer and reset it at 6195 WLM. RU and swab for rate and clean up.

If swab rates indicate perforation breakdown is not needed, skip to step 24. Otherwise,
move and set packer at ~6100°.

RU to break down and ball off the isolated perforation interval using 2500 gallons of
completion fluid mixed with 5 gpt Halliburton GasPerm 1000 and 250 mixed ball sealers
(half BioBalls and half buoyant balls) as follows.

Fluids and Additives:
Breakdown Fluid: 2500 gallons completion fluid (Wolverine provided) with added
5 gpt GasPerm 1000.
Diverter: 250 Diverter Balls including 125 BioBalls MR (7/8”, green) and 125

7/8” 0.90 S.G. balls.
Displacement Fluid (CF): 40 Barrels

Maximum Injection Pressure: 5000 psi
Injection Rate: 2-5 BPM

Pump Schedule:
A. Pressure test surface lines to 5000+ psi.

B. Establish a rate into the isolated perforations with CF (no balls).
C. Open bypass on packer.
D

. Pump 500 gallons (11.9 Bbls) of Breakdown Fluid (with no balls) at a rate of
1.5 BPM.

E. Pump 1000 gallons (23.8 Bbls) of Breakdown Fluid containing 125 buoyant
balls (one per 8.0 gallons) at a rate of 1.5 BPM.

F. Close bypass on packer.

G. Pump 1000 gallons (23.8 Bbls) of Breakdown Fluid containing 125 BioBalls
(one per 8.0 gallons) at a rate of rate of 2-5 BPM and 4000 - 5000 psi.

H. Pump 1680 gallons (40 Bbls) of CF to displace Breakdown Fluid and balls at a
rate of 2-5 BPM and 4000 - 5000 psi.

I Shut well in, record ISIP, and monitor pressure for 15 minutes.

Open well, make a couple of swab runs to release ball sealers, open bypass on packer, and
reverse circulate 40+ Bbls of CF at 1.5 BPM to recover buoyant balls. Close bypass and
swab back for cleanup until load fluid is recovered and rate, fluid level, and water-cut
stabilize.

Release packer and RIH to RBP. Reverse circulate clean, release RBP, and POOH with
tubing, packer, and RBP.
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25.

26.
27.
28.

29.

RIH with a barred tubing collar, one joint of 2-7/8” tubing, 5-1/2” (20#) production
packer, 6' 2-7/8” tubing sub, hydraulic lift pump cavity with standing valve in place, and
2-7/8” tubing. Set packer at ~6100°.

Land tubing, ND BOP and NU wellhead.
RDMOSU.

NU hydraulic lift unit and circulate clean fluid overnight. Drop recommended jet pump
and pump it to seat. Pressure up, check equipment, and turn well to production.

Plan to obtain a pressure build-up as soon as well production stabilizes.
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United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT TAKE
Utah State Office MAME
P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

http://www.blm.gov
IN REPLY REFER TO:
3160
(U-922)
October 9, 2008

Wolverine Gas and Oil Corp
One Riverfront Plaza

55 Campau, N.W.

Grand Rapids, MI 49503-2616
Attn: Richard D. Moritz

Re:  Non-Paying Well Determination
17-8 Well, Wolverine Unit
Sevier County, Utah
Gentlemen:

Pursuant to your request of October 8, 2008, it has been determined by this office that under
existing conditions the following well is not capable of producing unitized substances in paying
quantities as defined in Section 9 of the unit agreement from the Sub-thrust Twin Creek
Formation.

API Number Well Name Location Comp. Date Lease

4304130047 17-8 NESW 17 230 S 10 W SLB&M  04/08/2008 UTU73528
All past and future production from the Sub-thrust Twin Creek Formation produced from this
well shall be handled and reported on a lease basis. The Sub-thrust Twin Creek completion has
been temporarily abandoned and the well was recompleted in the Navajo Formation on
September 26, 2008. The Navajo production is being reported to the Navajo Participating Area,
UTUS80800A.
If you have any questions please contact Mickey Coulthard of this office at (801) 539-4042.

Sincerely,

/s/ Becky J. Hammond

n\",“Eﬁn Jf‘ b\! K‘ﬂc?ﬁ
p‘(::,\r;‘.rj;\rﬂ-?\,\sz:m“‘ ‘i._‘ ng Becky J. Hammond
\s,.»,(-;ﬂs and M 0\\\\:( Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals
O‘ 3 -
~cCORD
FOR RE RECEIVED

OCT 14 2008

Prioe”

RICA

DIV, OF OlL, GAS & MINING



becc: FOM Richfield
Wolverine Unit File
MMS
SITLA
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Central Files
Agr. Sec. Chron.
Fluid Chron
Tickler (December, 2008)

MCoulthard:mc:10-9-08
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7. 1T Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well
YOO Sbiwelnn  [JGasWelnn  [oter

Wolverine Unit

8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operalor w1 erine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC

‘Wolverine Federal 17-8
9. API Well No.

. 3a Address

3b. Phone No. (include area code)
55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI 49503

616-458-1150

4364130047

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R, M., or Survey Description)
2020' FSL, 1602' FWL, Sec. 17, T23S, R1W, SLB&M

Covenant Field, Navajo
11. County or Parish, State

Sevier County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[ Acidize L] Deepen ] Production (Start/Resume) [T water Shut-Off
[ INotice of tent [ Ateer Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity
Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other
Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon
D Final Abandonment Notice D Convert to Injection |:] Plug Back I:] Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof,
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after ail requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

The producing Twin Creek2 completion was temporarily abandoned below a retrievable bridge plug. The 5-1/2" casing was pulled from 6580°.
It was replaced with 5-1/2", 204, L-80/HCP-110/N-80 LTC/FJ casing and the new casing was cemented using 660 sacks of Class G cement to
prevent further damage to the 9-5/8" intermediate casing by collapsing salt sections. Navajol was then completed in select intervals at 6178° —
63347 by perforating with 6 SPF and breaking the perforations down by pumping completion fluid and ball sealers. The Navajol was then

placed on production with an ESP.

An attached Recompletion Summary and Results report contains more details of the completed work.

AL

RECEIVED
OCT 1 6 2008
DIV, OF OlL, GAS & MINING

Lo oDt 2

14. Ihereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Ellis Peterson

Title Sr. Production Engineer

swar 20 ol Dee

10/06/2008

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by ‘ Title

Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations therson,

Title 18 US.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 US.C. Section 1212, make ita crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to anymatter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)



Recompletion Summary and Results

Wolverine Federal 17-8
Covenant Field
July 9, 2008 to September 26, 2008

Purpose of Workover: Recomplete Lower Navajo

Work Summary: -

1.

2.
3.

10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

Set Arrowset-1 packer with H-valve (equivalent to RBP) at 7100’ and dump
bailed 2 sacks of sand on top.

Cut 5-1/2” casing off at 6580’ using a hydraulic mechanical blade cutter.

Pulled 5-1/2” casing above 6580’ out and laid it down. Pulled up to 140k over
string weight to pull casing out.

Ran a 6” gauge ring on wireline and set down at 5575°. Ran a Schlumberger
Isolation Scanner log and found deformed casing across lower salt intervals.
Cement top behind 9-5/8” casing was at approximately 1450°.

Ran 5-7/8” gauge ring on wireline and set down at 5584°. Ran a multi-finger
caliper and recorded minimum ID of 5.28” at 5581°.

Perforated 8 squeeze holes at 6630° — 6632°.

Swaged 9-5/8” casing using swage sizes ranging from 5-1/2” to 5-7/8” OD. A 6”
OD swage could not be worked through the deformed casing.

Ran 17 joints (1025°) of 5-1/2”, 20#, L-80, Ultra-flush joint casing with a square
cut on bottom joint; 5 joints (203°) of 5-1/2”, 204, HCP-110, LTC casing; and 126
joints (5358”) of 5-1/2”, 20#, N-80, LTC casing to surface. Twelve bow spring
centralizers were run and spaced from 5574 to 4124,

A 20-foot long Halliburton alignment tool was run on a cement retainer with
tubing to straddle the casing splice at 6580° and the cement retainer was set at
6567".

The 5-1/2” x 9-5/8” casing annulus was cemented by pumping 160 Bbls of packer
fluid, 5 Bbls fresh water, 139 Bbls of cement (660 sacks Class ‘G’, 15.8 ppg,
1.186 CF/sk), and 37 Bbls fresh water displacement.

Drilled out cement retainer, alignment tool, and cement in 5-1/2” casing and
circulated clean. Cement was from cement retainer at 6567’ to 6639°.

Cleaned tubing and casing with caustic/acid solutions and spotted 9+ ppg salt
water containing packer fluid chemicals bottom of 5-1/2” casing.

Ran a radial CBL in 5-1/2” casing from 7082 to 3050° under 2500 psi pressure.
Top of cement behind 5-1/2” casing was at approximately 3250°.

Perforated 6311° — 6334’ using 4” hollow carriers loaded 6 SPF. Casing gun had
slight drag at approximately 5580°.

Performed a break-down on perforations at 6311° — 6334” using 2000 gallons of
completion fluid and 200 ball sealers.

Swabbed perforations at 6311° — 6334” with FSR of 32 BPH, 98% OC, 3 runs/hr,
and FFL of 3200’ pulling from 4500°.

Set RBP at 6300°.



18. Perforated 6276’ — 6291’ and 6240’ — 6260’ using 4” hollow carriers loaded 6
SPF. Casing gun had slight drag at approximately 5580°.

19. Performed a break-down on perforations at 6276’ — 6291’ and 6240° — 6260’
using 2500 gallons of completion fluid and 300 ball sealers.

20. Swabbed perforations at 6276’ — 6291° and 6240’ — 6260° with FSR of 29 BPH,
99% OC, 3 runs/hr, and FFL of 2600’ pulling from 3800°.

21. Moved RBP to 6235°.

22. Perforated 6202’ — 6222 and 6178 — 6188’ using 3-3/8” hollow carriers loaded 6
SPF. Casing gun had no increase in drag at approximately 5580°.

23. Performed a break-down on perforations at 6202° — 6222’ and 6178” — 6188’
using 2500 gallons of completion fluid and 250 ball sealers.

24. Swabbed perforations at 6202° — 6222’ and 6178’ — 6188 with FSR of 39 BPH,
100% OC, 3 runs/hr, and FFL of 2400’ pulling from 3100°.

25. Retrieved RBP.

26. Ran ESP. Placed well on production.

Active Perforations (Lower Navajo):
6178- 6188 MD (6178’- 6188° TVD), 10°, 60 holes
6202’- 6222’ MD (6202’- 6222° TVD), 20°, 120 holes
6240°- 6260° MD (6240’- 6260’ TVD), 20°, 120 holes
6276’- 6291’ MD (6276°- 6291° TVD), 15°, 90 holes
6311°- 6334° MD (6311°- 6334’ TVD), 23°, 138 holes

Temporarily Abandoned Perforations (Twin Creek2):
7996' - 8008' MID (7996' — 8008' TVD), 12', 48 holes
8014' - 8026' MD (8014' — 8026' TVD), 12, 48 holes
8050' - 8070' MD (8050' — 8070' TVD), 20", 80 holes
8088' - 8108' MD (8088' — 8108' TVD), 20, 80 holes

Production before Recompletion (Twin Creek2): 94 BOPD and 768 BWPD on hydraulic
jet pump

Production after Recompletion: 537 BOPD and 0 BWPD with 1550 psi FBHP

EMP, 10/6/2008, WGR-NASO1\Users$\epeterson\Field & Well Files\Covenant\17-8\Completion\WF 17-8 Navajol Completion Sunmary and Results 081001.doc



Form 3160-4
(April 2004

UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

WELL COMPLETION CR RECOMPLETION REPCRT AND LOG

FORM APPROVED
OMBNO. 1004-0137
Expires: March 31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.

UTU-73528
la. Typeof Well [Z]oil Well [ ]Gas Well [ _IDry [_]Other 6. If Indian, Allottee o Tribe Name
b. Type of Completion: [/INew Well  [JWork Over [_JDecpen [ ]PlugBack [ _]Diff. Resr,. N.A.
Other 7 Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.

Name of Operator - yyo1yerine Gas and Oil Co. of Utah, LLC

Wolverine Federal Unit

8. Lease Name and Well No.
‘Wolverine Federal 17-8

3. Address 55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI 49503

3a  Phone No. (include area code)
616-458-1150

5. AFT Well No.
4304130047

4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements)*

At surface

2020' FSL, 1602' FWL, Sec. 17, T238, RIW

At top prod. interval reported below  2020" FSL, 1602' FWL, Sec. 17, T23S, RIW

Attotal depth  2020" FSL, 1620 FWL, Sec. 17, T238, RIW

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
Covenant Field, Navajo

1. Sec., T.,R., M., on Block and
Survey or Area 17, T238, RIW,

NESW, SLB&M
12 County or Parish |13 State

Sevier UT

14. Date Spudded

15. Date T.D. Reached

16. Date Completed  go/25/2008

17 Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)*

06/16/2007 09/07/2007 [CJp&A  [F]Ready to Prod. 5819' KB, 5793' GL
18. Total Depth: MD 13760" 19. Plug Back TD.: MD 8130 20. Depth Bridge Plug Set: MDD 8200'
TVD 137600 TVD 130" VD 8200'

21 TypeElectric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy of each)

Isolation Scanner, CBL

Was DST nm?

22. Waswellcored? [ INo L_]Yes (Submit analysis)

[ZNo DYes (Submit report)

Directional Smvey? [/ No [_]¥es (Submit copy)

2B, Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)

Hole Size | Size/Grade | Wt (#/ft) | Top MD) | Bottom (MD) Stag;fp:;? eater lergéogf %]‘é;g;t SI%OI' Cement Top* Amount Pulled
30.0" 20" 0.25 wall | Surface 115 Prev. Report Surface
17.5" 13.375J | 68.0 Surface 1915 Prev. Report Surf. (CIR)
12.25" 9.625 P 47.0 Surface 6985 5671 Prev. Report 1450 (CBL)
8.50" S50L/N | 20 6580 9524 6816 170 C+805G | 315 7000 (CBL)
" " " 425 50:50 Poz | 136
" "L/N/P | " Surface 6580 6580 660 Class G 139 3250 (CBL)
24, Tubing Record
Size Depth Set (MD)| Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) |Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) | Packer Depth (MD)
23/8 8058 8036 2-7/8 7956 7956
25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status
A)  Navajo2 8360 8370 8360 - 8370 0.40" 60 P&A
B Navajo2 8210 8220 8210 - 8220 0.40" 60 P&A
C) Twin Creek2 7996 8108 7996 - 8108 0.40" 256 TA
D Navajol 6178 6334 6178 - 6334 0.40" 528 - Active
27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, ete.
Depth Interval Amount and Type of Material
8210 - 8370 Perforations were squeeze cemented with 5.1 Bbls of Class "G" cement through a cement retainer at 8200".
6178 - 6334 All Navajol perforations where broken down by pumping treated produced water with ball sealers.

28. Production - Interval A

Date First | Test Hours Test Qil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced | Date Tested Production | BBL MCF BBL Com. AP Gravity
02/08/2008 | 7.5 ““‘) 0 0 218 Swabbing
Choke Thg. Press. | Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas/Qil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio
S — Plugged
28a. Production - Interval B ‘
Date First | Test Hours Test 0Oil Gas Water il Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced | Date Tested Production | BRL MCF BBL Corr. APT Gravity
02/05/2008 | 10 —_ |0 0 363 Swabbing
Choke Thg Press.|. Csg. 24Hr. oil Gas Water Gas/Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio
St —'> Plugged

RECEIVED -

*(See instructions and spaces

‘or additional data on page 2)

OCT 16 2008
DV, GF OIL, GAS & MINING

o

4
]
4

%



28b. Production - Interval C

Date First | Test Hours Test . |[Ol Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced | Date Tested Production. | BB MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity
02/14/2008 | 04/10/2008 | 24 176 Tr 352 39 Temporary Hydraulic Pump
Choke Tog. Press. | Csg. 4 Hr Qit Gas Water Gas/Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio
SI _...) 170 Tr 352 Temporarily Abandoned
28c. Production - Interval D
Date First | Test Hours Test 0il Gas Water 0il Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced | Date Tested | Production | BRL MCF BBL Cotr, APL Gravity
09/12/2008 | 10/04/2008 | 24 537 TLTM 0 40 Electric Submersible Pump
Choke Thg Press.| Csg, 24 H. ol Gas Water Gas/Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio
SI 40 3 537 0 9 Producing
29. Disposition of Gas (Sold, used for fuel, vented, etc.)
Vented
30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem
tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures
and recoveries.

. - To
Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name Meas: Deph
Navajo 2 8206 9470 Water Arapien Surface
Twin Creek 2 7876 8206 Water and Oil Twin Creek 1 5614
Wingate 1 7227 7644 Water Navajo 1 5912
Kayenta 1 7088 7227 Water Chinle 1 7644
Navajo 1 5912 7088 ‘Water and Oil Twin Creek 2 7876
Navajo 2 8206
Chinle 2 9998
Moenkopi 10476
Sinbad ‘ 12116
Black Dragon 12503
Kaibab 12973
Toroweap 13350

32. Additional remarks (include plugging procedure):

Cement Plugs were set at 12,700 - 12,910' and 9850' - 10,150' before running 5-1/2" production casing. Navajo 2 perforations at 8360' - 8370' and
8210' - 8220' were cemented with 25 sacks (5.12 barrels) of Class "G" through a CICR at 8200'. The top of the cement plug was wireline tagged
at 8130' as the current PBTD.

Twin Creek?2 isolated below a RBP. 5-1/2" casing is cut and spliced at 6580'. Lower Navajol completed at 6178" - 6334",

33. Indicate which itmes have been attached by placing a check in the appropriate boxes:

Electrical/Mechanical Logs (1 full set req'd.) ' Geologic Report DST Report Directional Survey
q
] Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification [_] Core Analysis Other:

34. Thereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

Sr. Production Engineer

Name (pleizse prin) Ellis Peterson Title
Py
Signature Date 10/07/2008

Title: 18 US.C Section 1001 and Title 43 US.C Section 1212, makeit a crime for any person knowingly and willfully fo make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent stateraents or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Form 31604, page 2)



Form 3160-5 '  UNITED STATES i
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

FORM APPROVED
OMB No. 10040137
Expires: March 31,2007

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-73528
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side. 7. 1 Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

‘Wolverine Unit

"1. Typeo
» fﬁOﬂWellDD []GasWellc DOther

8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC 5 Z;l:;zﬁl;i‘ederal 178
32 Address 3b. PhoneNo. (include area code) 4304130047

55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI 49503 616-458-1150 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4, Location of Well ‘Waomge, Sec., T, R, M., or Survey Description) Covenant Field, Navajo

2020' FSL, 1602' FWL, Sec. 17, T23S, R1W, SLB&M 11. County or Parish, State

Sevier County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOIICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION . TYPE OF ACTION .
] Acidize [ peepen [production (StartResume) LI Water Shut-Off
D Notice of Intent Alter Casing D Fracture Treat D Reclamation Well Integrity
by Casing Repair [ New Construction D Recomplete Other
Subsequent Report .
I:l ) ) |:| Change Plans - I:I Plug and Abandon D Temporarily Abandon
Final Abandonmer.xt Notice D Convert to Injection D Plug Back D Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.

If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Requited subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following cornpletion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160~4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

The 9-5/8" casing was swaged out to 5-7/8" through a collapsed interval at 5574' - 5583', A 5-1/2" casing string was run that consisting of 20#,
L-80, Ultra-Flush Joint from 5555' to 6580'; 20#, HCP-110, LTC from 5352' to 5555'; and 20#, N-80, LTC from surface to 5352'. The casing was
cemented in place using 660 sacks (139 Bbls) of 15.8 ppg Class "G" cement on 10/19/2008. A total of 12 centralizers were run and spaced
through an interval from 4124' to 5574". The bottom of the new 5-1/2" casing butts to the cut-off casing at 6580' and was held in place to

continuous drift while cementing using an alignment tool.

After drilling out cement and the alignment tool and cleaning out of the new production casing, it is planned to complete the Navajo 1 at depths
from 6178' to 6334' as previously approved but through the 5-1/2” and 9-5/8” concentric casing strings. A procedure with revised details of the

planned completion work is included herewith.

Workaver activities on this Covenant Field well will resume on 8/26/2008. The Navajol completion work will have duration of approximately

four weeks.

14. Thereby certify that the foregomg istrue and correct -

Name (Printed/Typed)
“ Ellis Peterson Title Sr.Production Engineer

SimnW Date - 08/20/2008

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approvedty Title Dae 7 / 29/0¥
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease | oice AcceptEd For RQCOfd Purposes
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. e g ZEETY

Title 18 US.C. Section 1001 and Title43 US.C. Section 1212, make ita crime for any person knowingly and willfully tomaketo any departmenM @:ﬁcy BEho! Unitd

States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representatxons as to anymatter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)

0GFPH00I3S "
HDoGH .

OCT 29 2008
Div. OF OiL, GAS 8 WINING



Fomn 31605

(April 2004) UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

FORM APPROVED
OMB No. 1004-0137
Expires: March 31, 2007
5. Lease Serial No.
UTU-73528
6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side.

7. ' Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well
Ve biwenn  [Joeswelon  [Joter

Wolverine Unit

8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC

Wolverine Federal 17-8
9. APIWellNo.

3a  Address
55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI 49503

3b. Phone No. (include area code)
616-458-1150

4304130047

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R, M, or Survey Description)
2020’ FSL, 1602' FWL, Sec. 17, T23S, R1W, SLB&M

Covenant Field, Navajo
11. County or Parish, State

Sevier County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOIICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[ Acidize L] Deepen ] Production (Start/Resumne) [ water Shus0ft
Notice of Intent D Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity
] Subsequent Report [_ICasing Repair [ New Construction L] Recomplete Other Work-Over
[:] i _ I—_—I Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon
Final Abandonment Notice L__.] Convert to Injection L—_l Plug Back D Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estirnated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 31604 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC plan to undertake a work-over on the Wolverine Federal 17-8, which is part of the Covenant
Field. Based on the analysis of the well, the existing perforations are under performing. Therefore, we intend to acid treat existing perforations.

Once the work is completed, the well will be returned to production.

COPY SENT TO GPERATOR

Date: kaZ[ 2610
Initigls: %6

RECEIVED
JUN 14 2010
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

14. Thereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Edward A. Hig)éa

Title Manager - Production

Signature Date

06/11/2010

lv\ . THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

e

Approvedby _XQ}_Z/_ _\ib.\\_)?_/_‘i\_;(—_f _________ Title Q&: EAj .

Date 49//6//6

R

certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Conditions of approval, if atiy, are attached, Approval of this notice does niot warrant or
Office m QPLVAN

Federal Approval Of This
Action Is Necessary

Title 18 US.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make ita crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations s to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)



Form 3160-5

(April 2004) UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

FORM APPROVED
OM B No. 1004-0137
Expires: March 31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.
UTU-73528

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side.

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well
P OilWellEJD [[]Gaswellan [ Other

Wolverine Unit

8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC

Wolverine Federal 17-8
9, API Well No.

3a. Address
55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI 49503

3b. Phone No. (include area code)
616-458-1150

4304130047
10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R., M., or Survey Description)
2020' FSL, 1602' FWL, Sec. 17, T23S, R1W, SLB&M

Covenant Field, Navajo
11. County or Parish, State

Sevier County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
Acidize I:' Deepen D Production (Start/Resume) [:I Water Shut-Off
[ Noticeof ntent (] Atter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity
Subsequent Report E-] Casing Repair ] New Construction EI Recomplete Other
e , [ Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon
Final Abandonment Notice D Convert to Injection D Plug Back D Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah LLC completed a workover on the Wolverine Federal 17-8 on August 30, 2011. Prior to the workover
the well was making approximately 100 BOPD and 100 BWPD. During swabbing of selected intervals, communication was noted between all
perforation sets from behind pipe. A decision was made to acid stimulate all perforation sets with one acid job. Perforations from 6178’ - 6334
were stimulated with 5000 gallens of 7-1/2 % FE HCL acid and 250 buoyant balls. The intervals were swabbed for rate and clean up and an
ESP was run in the hole. Initial rates were 150 BOPD & 150 BWPD.

See attached WBD and Activity Report for additional details.

RECEIVED
0CT 07 201

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
14. [hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct

Name (Printed/Typed)

Matthew Rivers Title Production Engineer
Signature /( . Date 10/05/2011
THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approvedby o ____ Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make ita crime forany person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United

(Instructions on page 2)

States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations s to any matter within its jurisdiction.



8/18/2011

8/23/2011

8/24/2011

8/25/2011

8/26/2011

Covenant Field SHL NE/SW Sec 17, T23S, R1W
Federal 17-8 BHL NE/SW Sed 17, T23S, R1W
APIl# 43-041-30047 Sevier County, Utah

MIRUSU, hauled in frac tanks, rig pump and water filtration system. Hooked up flow back and pump lines,
filled frac tanks with CF and filtered the water through 5 micron filters.

Plan to pull out of hole with ESP then TIH with bit and scraper.

Shut well in and dropped bar to break drain sub on the ESP, Hooked up pump lines and pumped 1 bbl of 4%
KCL water down tubing, ND wellhead, NU BOP's. RU vac truck to casing, RU cable spooler and POOH with
ESP. PU & RIH 4 5/8" bit and 5 1/2" casing scraper to PBTD @ 7080', reverse circulated 150 bbls of 4% KCL
water. SWIFN

Plan to POOH with bit and casing scraper then RIH with plug and packer to swab 6311'-6334', 6276'-6291' &
6240'-6260'".

Opened well, POOH with bit and scraper, PU & RIH with plug and packer. Set plug at 6350', set packer at
6301', RU swab equipment, made 8 swab runs recovering 5 bbls of oil and 79 bbls of water with a fluid level
of 4100' and a rate of 360 bpd. RD swab equipment, RU pump Iineé and injected into perf interval 6311'-6334'
at a rate of 1 bpm @ 800 psi tubing pressure with returns up the annulus. RD pump lines, released packer
and plug, reset plug at 6300, set packer at 6150', RU swab equipment, made 6 runs recovering 6 bbls of oil
and 76 bbls of water with a final fluid level of 4800' with a rate not yet determined.

Plan to continue swabbing for rate then move plug and packer to swab perf intervals 6178'-6188' & 6202’ -
6222'.

Opened well, RU swab equipment, made 13 swab runs recovering 37 bbls oil, 61 bbls of water with a FL of
1400', rate of 360 bpd, with a 20% water cut. RD swab equipment, released packer and plug, reset plug at
6350', set packer at 6154'. RU pump lines and pressure tested packer to 1500 psi, RD pump lines and SWIFN
Plan to pump acid on all perf intervals then swab for rate and clean up.

Opened well, 0 psi, RU Halliburton acid equipment, pressure tested lines to 6000 psi and pumped acid job
on all perf intervals from 6178'-6334' as follows:

Bbls Max psi Max rate  Fluid Description

5.00 50 1.5bpm 4% KCL water Established circulation
35.00 96 1.5bpm 7 1/2% HCL acid Spotted acid with 250 7/8" .90 S.G. buoyant balls.
~ ~ ~ ~ Closed packer

31.00 1097 0.8bpm 7 1/2% HCL acid Shut in to let pressure drop
13.00 1096 0.8bpm 7 1/2% HCL acid Shut in to let pressure drop
39.00 1220 0.8bpm 7 1/2% HCL acid

28.00 1614 1.5 Acid & water Increased rate to 1.5 bpm
13.00 1885 2 4% KCL water Increased rate to 2.0 bpm
~ 1736 ~ ~ ISIP

~ 1329 ~ ~ 5 Min

~ 1120 ~ ~ 10 Min

Total Max psi Max rate

164.00 1885 2

See 8-26-11 Acid pressure chart for details.

Page 1 of 2 Daily Activity



8/272011

8/28/2011

8/29/2011

Supervisor:

RU swab equipment, made 1 swab run then was unable to get through tubing due to a piece of packer rubber
being suspended with balls. Made several attempts to free up tubing blockage with no success. SWIFN

Plan to pull tubing to clear blockage then reset packer and swab for rate and clean up.

POOH with tubing and packer, RIH with one stand and circulated balls out of casing, cleaned ball sealers from
flowback lines. RIH with tubing and packer, set packer at 6150'. RU swab equipment, made 11 swab runs
recovering 75 bbls of water, 23 bbls of oil with a 90% water cut and a final fluid level of 1800’ from surface, an
inflow rate has not been determined yet. SWIFN. See 8-27 swab report tab for details

Plan to continue swabbing for rate and clean up.

Opened well, RU swab equipment, made 28 swab runs recovering 81 bbls oil, 146 bbis of water with a FL of
3275%', rate of 500 bpd, with a 50% water cut. SWIFN See 8-28-11 Swab report for details

Plan to continue swabbing while the downhole pump is being built.

Opened well, RU swab equipment, made 15 swab runs recovering 60 bbls oil, 70 bbls of water with a FL of
2658, rate of 540 bpd, with a 50% water cut. RD swab equipment, released packer and plug, POOH with
tubing, plug and packer. SWIFN See 8-29-11 Swab report for details

Plan to install ESP

Tony E. (ool Rig Operator:

Page 2 of 2 Daily Activity



WOLVERINE Wolverine Federal 17-8
API # 43-041-30047

Covenant Field

Section 17, T23S, R1W

Sevier County, Utah

Ground Elevation: 5,793 (Not to Scale)
KB Elevation: 5,819’
115 Vertical Well
“““““““““““ Surface: 2020' FSL 1602' FWL, NE SW, 17-23S-1W
Total Depth:  2020' FSL 1602' FWL, NE SW, 17-23S-1W
Conductor Casing (06/15/07)
Size: 20", 0.25" wall
Depth Landed: 115' KB
_____ 1918° Cement Data: Cemented to surface with 14 yds redi-mix
i Surface Casing (7/04/07)
| e TOCXXC_ Size/WH/Grade: 13 3/8”, 68#, J-55, STC, 8rd
- L] —— Depth Landed: 1915' KB
Tl == || .. Cement Data: 352 sks CBM light (10.5 ppg, 4.33 cf/sk), 470 sks Type V
(15.6 ppg, 1.19 cf/sk), Cemented to surface
Pl 5329 Intermediate Casing (7/26/07)
“““““““““ Size/Wt/Grade: 9-5/8", 47#, HCP-110, LTC, 8rd
Depth Landed: 6985' KB, stage tool @ 5671' KB
) i— Cement Data: Stage 1- 570 sks 50:50 Poz, 14.4 ppg, 1.26 cf/sk
Stage 2- 170 sks CBM Lite, 1.5 ppg, 4.29 cf/sk
= 1 Stg tool 5671’ 805 sks Class G, 15.8 ppg, 1.29 cffsk
L] L Production Casing (9/15/07 & 8/17/08
= §§ S — Size/Wt/Grade: 5-1/2", 20#, L-80/HCP-110, LTC 8rd/Ultra-FJ
=T = Properties: 9190 psi burst, 4.653" drift, 4.778" ID, 0.0221 Bbl/ft Capacity
i T Geg Alignment Depth Landed: 9524' KB
tool 6580" Stage tool: (Weatherford POST 781) @ 6816' KB
E i Eom— Splice: Cut & realigned @ 6580' KB, squeeze holes at 6630'- 6632' KB
Cement Data: 425 sks 50:50 Poz, 13.4 ppg, 1.8 cf/sk (9/15/07)
= c eloe 660 sks Class “G”, 15.8 ppg, 1.15 cf.sk (8/19/08)
. Navajo Perforations
>”‘§'3£°“< ___RBP 6178- 6188 MD (6178’- 6188 TVD), 10°, 60 holes (9/19/08)
i | o 6202’- 6222’ MD (6202’- 6222’ TVD), 20, 120 holes (9/19/08)
= Twin Creek = 82805 6240"- 6260° MD (6240™- 6260’ TVD), 20’, 120 holes (9/12/08)
I Il Pkr 8036' 6276- 6291’ MD (6276’- 6291’ TVD), 15, 90 holes (9/12/08)
xﬁx ------------------ 6311'- 6334’ MD (6311"- 6334’ TVD), 23, 138 holes (9/6/08)
C 5 8210 -8220' Mid-Perf = 6256' MD (6256' TVD), 88' M (88.0' TV), 528 holes
PBTD 8130
e ey Tubing (8/30/2011) (see Page 2 for details)
= = 8360 - 8370 End of BHA 5351 WLM (5351' TVD)
A Centinel 5347 WLM (5347' TVD)
- U Pump intake  5329' WLM (5329' TVD)
Seating Nipple 5248' WLM (5248' TVD)
9850'-10150" mg
12700-12910" (08/23/11) 7080’ - Tubing tag with wireline correction

(08/05/08) 7080' - WL tag of sand plug
(02/13/08) 8130' - WL tag

(02/11/08) 8200’ - CICR (tubing set)
(01/23/08) 9378' - CBL logger depth
(09/15/07) 9431' - Float Collar

MCR 10/5/11



Section 17, T23S,
Sevier County,

Wolverine Federal 17-8
APl # 43-041-30047
Covenant Field

R1W
Utah

Tubing Detail (8/30/2011)

26.00 KB
-2.00 Landed above GL
165 5225.74 Tubing - 2-7/8", 6.5#, N-80, EUE, 8rd
1 1.10 Cup type SN
2 63.43 Tubing - 2-7/8", 6.5#, N-80, EUE, 8rd
1 0.48 Drain sub
1 0.77 X-over - 2-3/8" x 2-7/8", EUE, 8rd
1 14.98 Pump
1 6.10 Seal
1 11.93 Motor
1 4.10 Downhole pressure sensor, Centinel Ill, 4.50" OD (5347' MD, 5347' TVD)
2.0 Wireline correction

5350.63' EOT (56351 KB MD-WLM, 5351' TVD)

Note: No check valve in this well.
Wireline measurements are 5’ shallow to SLM.
Tubing capacity = 0.00579 Bbl/ft, Burst = 10570 psi, Joint Yield = 144960 Ibs

Twin Creek Perforations

7996' - 8008' MD (7996’ — 8008' TVD), 12', 48 holes (2/13/08)
8014' - 8026' MD (8014' — 8026' TVD), 12', 48 holes (3/29/08)
8050' - 8070' MD (8050' — 8070' TVD), 20", 80 holes (2/13/08)
8088' - 8108' MD (8088' — 8108' TVD), 20", 80 holes (2/13/08)

Mid-Perf = 8052' MD (8052' TVD), 64' M (64.0' TV), 256 holes

Wellhead Information

- Tubing head flange is 7-1/16", 5M with a 2-7/8" EUE 8rd top connection.
- South valve in cellar is to the 13-3/8" x 9-5/8" annulus?

- North valve in cellar is to the 9-5/8" x 5-1/2" annulus?

Stimulation
- 08/26/11 Pumped 5000 gallons of 7-%2% FE HCL w/ 250 buoyant balls into all Navajo perf intervals

- All perforated Navajo intervals broken down using completion fluid and ball sealers during completion.

Surface Location: Latitude = 38.78729, Longitude = -111.93382

(1/23/08) Original top of Cement behind 5-%2" @ 7003’

(1/28/08) Cement squeezed leaking POST with 30 sks micromatrix cement.

(10/7/08): Available Logs: Halliburton- DLL/MSFL, HRI, SDL/DSN, MRIL
Schlumberger- AIT/TLD/HGNS/MCFL, All/GR, BHC/GR, CBL, Isolation Scan
Weatherford & Baker Atlas- caliper logs

MCR 10/5/11



Form 3160-5 :
(Apri 3004) UNITED STATES OB No. 0090137

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires: March 31,2007
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 3 Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-73528
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enteran 6. 1f Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side. 7. If Usit or CA/Agrecment, Name and/or No.
| Tvpe of Well Wolverine Unit
. Yy &
P OilWellU 17 []GasWellxd [} Other 2. Well Name and No.
. Wolverine Federal 17-8
2. Name of Operator Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC 9. API Well No.
3a Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304130047
55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI 49503 616-458-1150 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R, M., or Survey Description) Covenant Field, Navajo

2020' FSL, 1602' FWL, Sec. 17, T23S, R1W, SLB&M 11, County or Parish, State

Sevier County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
Acidize L] beepen [_Jproduction (StartResume) Ll Water Shut-Off
r——l Notice of Intent !:] Alter Casing I:l Fracture Treat D Reclamation D Well Integrity
Subsequent Report I:I Casing Repair I:l New Construction I:I Recomplete I:I Other
] ) D Change Plans D Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon
El Final Abandoniment Notice D Convert to Injection I:l Plug Back D Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
if the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah LLC completed a workover on the Wolverine Federal 17-8 on August 30, 2011. Prior to the workover

\ the well was making approximately 100 BOPD and 100 BWPD. During swabbing of selected intervals, communication was noted between all
perforation sets from behind pipe. A decision was made to acid stimulate all perforation scts with one acid job. Perforations from 6178' - 6334'
were stimulated with 5000 gallons of 7-1/2 % FE HCL acid and 250 buoyant balls. The intervals were swabbed for rate and clean up and an
ESP was run in the hole. Initial rates were 150 BOPD & 150 BWPD.

See attached WBD and Activity Report for additional details.

RECEIVED RECEIVED

0CT 18 201 0CT 7 20M

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
Richfield BLM Field Office

14. Thereby certify thatthe foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Mat)hew Rivers Title Production Engineer
y

Signature M/{ - Date 10/05/2011

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 US.C. Section 1001 and Title43 US.C. Section 1212, make ita crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)

Sty *r2craomns Accepted For Record Purposes CONFIDENTIAL



8/18/2011

8/23/2011

8/24/2011

8/25/2011

8/26/2011

Covenant Field SHL NE/SW Sec 17, T23S, R1W
Federal 17-8 BHL NE/SW Sed 17, T23S, R1W
API# 43-041-30047 Sevier County, Utah

MIRUSU, hauled in frac tanks, rig pump and water filtration system. Hooked up flow back and pump lines,
filled frac tanks with CF and filtered the water through 5 micron filters.

Plan to pull out of hole with ESP then TIH with bit and scraper.

Shut well in and dropped bar to break drain sub on the ESP, Hooked up pump lines and pumped 1 bbl of 4%
KCL water down tubing, ND wellhead, NU BOP's. RU vac truck to casing, RU cable spooler and POOH with
ESP. PU & RIH 4 5/8" bit and 5 1/2" casing scraper to PBTD @ 7080', reverse circulated 150 bbls of 4% KCL
water. SWIFN

Plan to POOH with bit and casing scraper then RIH with plug and packer to swab 6311'-6334', 6276'-6291' &
6240'-6260'.

Opened well, POOH with bit and scraper, PU & RIH with plug and packer. Set plug at 6350', set packer at
6301', RU swab equipment, made 8 swab runs recovering 5 bbls of oil and 79 bbls of water with a fluid level
of 4100" and a rate of 360 bpd. RD swab equipment, RU pump lines and injected into perf interval 6311'-6334'
at a rate of 1 bpm @ 800 psi tubing pressure with returns up the annulus. RD pump lines, released packer
and plug, reset plug at 6300', set packer at 6150', RU swab equipment, made 6 runs recovering 6 bbls of oil
and 76 bbls of water with a final fluid level of 4800" with a rate not yet determined.

Plan to continue swabbing for rate then move plug and packer to swab perf intervals 6178'-6188' & 6202' -
6222'.

Opened well, RU swab equipment, made 13 swab runs recovering 37 bbls oil, 61 bbls of water with a FL of
1400', rate of 360 bpd, with a 20% water cut. RD swab equipment, released packer and plug, reset plug at
6350', set packer at 6154'. RU pump lines and pressure tested packer to 1500 psi, RD pump lines and SWIFN
Plan to pump acid on all perf intervals then swab for rate and clean up.

Opened well, 0 psi, RU Halliburton acid equipment, pressure tested lines to 6000 psi and pumped acid job
on all perf intervals from 6178'-6334' as follows:

Bbls Max psi Maxrate Fluid Description

5.00 50 1.5bpm 4% KCL water Established circulation
35.00 96 1.5bpm 7 1/2% HCL acid Spotted acid with 250 7/8" .90 S.G. buoyant balls.
~ ~ ~ ~ Closed packer

31.00 1097 0.8bpm 7 1/2% HCL acid Shut in to let pressure drop
13.00 1096 0.8bpm 7 1/2% HCL acid Shut in to let pressure drop
39.00 1220 0.8 bpm 7 1/2% HCL acid

28.00 1614 15 Acid & water Increased rate to 1.5 bpm
13.00 1885 2 4% KCL water Increased rate to 2.0 bpm
~ 1736 ~ ~ [SIP

~ 1329 ~ ~ 5 Min

~ 1120 ~ ~ 10 Min

Total Max psi Max rate

164.00 1885 2

See 8-26-11 Acid pressure chart for details:

Page 1 of 2 Daily Activity



8/272011

8/28/2011

8/29/2011

Supervisor:

RU swab equipment, made 1 swab run then was unable to get through tubing due to a piece of packer rubber
being suspended with balls. Made several attempts to free up tubing blockage with no success. SWIFN

Plan to pull tubing to clear blockage then reset packer and swab for rate and clean up.

POOH with tubing and packer, RIH with one stand and circulated balls out of casing, cleaned ball sealers from
flowback lines. RIH with tubing and packer, set packer at 6150'. RU swab equipment, made 11 swab runs
recovering 75 bbls of water, 23 bbls of oil with a 90% water cut and a final fiuid level of 1800' from surface, an
inflow rate has not been determined yet. SWIFN. See 8-27 swab report tab for details

Plan to continue swabbing for rate and clean up.

Opened well, RU swab equipment, made 28 swab runs recovering 81 bbls oil, 146 bbis of water with a FL of .
3275%', rate of 500 bpd, with a 50% water cut. SWIFN See 8-28-11 Swab report for details

Plan to continue swabbing while the downhole pump is being built.

Opened well, RU swab equipment, made 15 swab runs recovering 60 bbis oil, 70 bbls of water with a FL of
2658, rate of 540 bpd, with a 50% water cut. RD swab equipment, released packer and plug, POOH with
tubing, plug and packer. SWIFN See 8-29-11 Swab report for details

Plan to install ESP

Towy E. (ool Rig Operator:

Page 2 of 2 Daily Activity



WOLVERINE Wolverine Federal 17-8
API # 43-041-30047

Covenant Field

Section 17, T23S, R1W

Sevier County, Utah

Ground Elevation: 5,793 (Not to Scale)
KB Elevation: 5,819
15 Vertical Well
C ------------------ Surface: 2020' FSL 1602' FWL, NE SW, 17-23S-1W

Total Depth: ~ 2020' FSL 1602' FWL, NE SW, 17-23S-1W

] Conductor Casing (06/15/07)
Size: 20", 0.25" wall

Depth Landed: 115' KB

[]

___________ Cement Data: Cemented to surface with 14 yds redi-mix
. Surface Casing (7/04/07
TG0 Size/WH/Grade: 13 3/8”, 68#, J-55, STC, 8rd
al — Depth Landed: 1915' KB

------------------ Cement Data: 352 sks CBM light (10.5 ppg, 4.33 cf/sk), 470 sks Type V
(15.6 ppg, 1.19 cf/sk), Cemented to surface

Pl 5329' Intermediate Casing (7/26/07)
""""""""""" Size/Wt/Grade: 9-5/8", 47#, HCP-110, LTC, 8rd

Depth Landed: 6985' KB, stage tool @ 5671' KB

- — Cement Data: Stage 1- 570 sks 50:50 Poz, 14.4 ppg, 1.26 cf/sk
' Stage 2- 170 sks CBM Lite, 1.5 ppg, 4.29 cf/sk
£ i Stg tool 5671 805 sks Class G, 15.8 ppg, 1.29 cf/sk
Production Casing (9/15/07 & 8/17/08)
S Size/Wt/Grade: 5-1/2", 20#, L-80/HCP-110, LTC 8rd/Ultra-FJ

Properties: 9190 psi burst, 4.653" drift, 4.778" ID, 0.0221 Bbl/ft Capacity
Gy Aligrmeit Depth Landed: 9524' KB

tool 6580" Stage tool: (Weatherford POST 781) @ 6816' KB

"""""""""" Splice: Cut & realigned @ 6580' KB, squeeze holes at 6630'- 6632' KB

l_ 2'
P Cement Data: 425 sks 50:50 Poz, 13.4 ppg, 1.8 cffsk (9/15/07)
Stg tool 6816’

I
17

------------------ 660 sks Class “G”, 15.8 ppg, 1.15 cf.sk (8/19/08)
.. 0985 Navajo Perforations
ERTENGE RBP 6178- 6188 MD (6178- 6188’ TVD), 10°, 60 holes (9/19/08)
_> <_ 6202'- 6222’ MD (6202'- 6222’ TVD), 20’, 120 holes (9/19/08)
] Twin Creek B 2020 8070 6240'- 6260’ MD (6240'- 6260’ TVD), 20’, 120 holes (9/12/08)
= = 8088' - 8108
= o GOE 6276'- 6291’ MD (6276'- 6291’ TVD), 15, 90 holes (9/12/08)
XEX ------------------ 6311’- 6334’ MD (6311’- 6334’ TVD), 23, 138 holes (9/6/08)
8210 -8220" Mid-Perf = 6256' MD (6256' TVD), 88' M (88.0' TV), 528 holes
PBTD 8130
.y Tubing (8/30/2011) (see Page 2 for details)
= = 8360 - 8370 End of BHA 5351 WLM (5351' TVD)
occoce Centinel 5347" WLM (5347' TVD)
- - Pump intake  5329' WLM (5329' TVD)
Seating Nipple 5248' WLM (5248' TVD)
985010150 PBTD
1270012910 (08/23/11) 7080' - Tubing tag with wireline correction

(08/05/08) 7080' - WL tag of sand plug
(02/13/08) 8130' - WL tag

(02/11/08) 8200’ - CICR (tubing set)
(01/23/08) 9378' - CBL logger depth
(09/15/07) 9431' - Float Collar

MCR 10/5/11



Wolverine Federal 17-8
API # 43-041-30047
Covenant Field
Section 17, T23S, R1W
Sevier County, Utah

Tubing Detail (8/30/2011)

26.00 KB
-2.00 Landed above GL
165 5225.74 Tubing - 2-7/8", 6.5#, N-80, EUE, 8rd
1 1.10 Cup type SN
2 63.43 Tubing - 2-7/8", 6.5#, N-80, EUE, 8rd
1 0.48 Drain sub
1 0.77 X-over - 2-3/8" x 2-7/8", EUE, 8rd
1 14.98 Pump
1 6.10 Seal
1 11.93 Motor
1 4.10 Downhole pressure sensor, Centinel 111, 4.50" OD (5347' MD, 5347' TVD)
2.0 Wireline correction

5350.63' EOT (5351' KB MD-WLM, 5351' TVD)

Note: No check valve in this well.
Wireline measurements are 5’ shallow to SLM.
Tubing capacity = 0.00579 Bbl/ft, Burst = 10570 psi, Joint Yield = 144960 Ibs

Twin Creek Perforations

7996' - 8008' MD (7996' — 8008' TVD), 12', 48 holes (2/13/08)
8014' - 8026' MD (8014' — 8026’ TVD), 12', 48 holes (3/29/08)
8050' - 8070' MD (8050' — 8070" TVD), 20", 80 holes (2/13/08)
8088' - 8108' MD (8088' — 8108’ TVD), 20', 80 holes (2/13/08)

Mid-Perf = 8052' MD (8052' TVD), 64' M (64.0' TV), 256 holes

Wellhead Information

- Tubing head flange is 7-1/16", 5M with a 2-7/8" EUE 8rd top connection.
- South valve in cellar is to the 13-3/8" x 9-5/8" annulus?
- North valve in cellar is to the 9-5/8" x 5-1/2" annulus?

Stimulation
- 08/26/11 Pumped 5000 gallons of 7-%2% FE HCL w/ 250 buoyant balls into all Navajo perf intervals
- All perforated Navajo intervals broken down using completion fluid and ball sealers during completion.

Notes
Surface Location: Latitude = 38.78729, Longitude = -111.93382
(1/23/08) Original top of Cement behind 5-%2" @ 7003’
(1/28/08) Cement squeezed leaking POST with 30 sks micromatrix cement.
(10/7/08): Available Logs: Halliburton- DLL/MSFL, HRI, SDL/DSN, MRIL

Schlumberger- AIT/TLD/HGNS/MCFL, All/GR, BHC/GR, CBL, Isolation Scan
Weatherford & Baker Atlas- caliper logs

MCR 10/5/11



Sundry Nunber: 34807 APl Well Nunber: 43041300470000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

STATE OF UTAH

FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU 73528

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WOLVERINE

1. TYPE OF WELL
Oil Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WOLVERINE FED 17-8

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
WOLVERINE GAS & OIL COMPANY OF UTAH, LLC

9. API NUMBER:
43041300470000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
One Riverfront Plaza 55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI, 49503 616 458-1150 Ext COVENANT
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SEVIER
2020 FSL 1602 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 17 Township: 23.0S Range: 01.0W Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
] acioize L] acTer casing [ casine repar
¥ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [ chanee To PReVios PLANS O chance Tusine O chanee weLt nave
] chance weLL staTus L] comMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [J convertweLL Tvee
[] susseqQueNT RePORT L] oeeren (] rraCTURE TREAT [J new consTrucTION
Date of Work Completion:
O] operaTor crance CJ pLuc anp ABanDON O ruseack
[ rrobuCTION START OR RESUME (] RecLamaTION OF weLL SITE [J RecompLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
[ spuo reporT
Date of Spud: (] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION (] sipETRACK TO REPAIR WELL [J remporary ABANDON
O tusine Repar O vent orFLare 0 warer pisposaL
[ oriLLinG RepoRT (] warer sHutore L] si7a sTaTus ExTENSION [J aro exrension
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION v‘( OTHER OTHER: IWorkover I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Wolverine Gas and Oil Co. of Utah, LLC has determined that the
Wolverine Federal 17-8 is underperforming and intends to workover the
well to improve its production. After re-perforating and acid stimulating

selected Navajo intervals, an ESP will be run and the well will be
returned to production. A follow-up summary of well work activities will

be filed, after work is completed.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

oy LA (Dot

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Helene Bardolph 616 458-1150 Engineering Administrative Assistant
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 2/19/2013

RECEI VED: Feb. 19, 2013




Form 3160-5
(September 2001)

UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM APPROVED
OMB No. 1004-0135
Expires January 31, 2004

5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDI},Y r;onc;es AND RIEPORTS ON WELLS UTU 73528
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an i ;
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. ; / AIf Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

Type of Well
Oil Well ] Gas Well

O other

Wolverine Federal Unit

8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator

Wolverine Gas & Oil Company of Utah, LLC

Wolverine Federal 17-8
9. API Well No.

3a. Address

55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, Ml 49503

3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43041300470000
616-458-1150

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)

SHL: 2020' FSL, 1602' FWL, Sec 17, T23S, R1W, SLB & M
BHL: 2020' FSL, 1620' FWL, Sec 17, T23S, R1W

Covenant
11. County or Parish, State
Sevier

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

4 Notice of Intent
| Subsequent Report

{J Final Abandonment Notice

TYPE OF ACTION
O Acidize a Deepen 1 Production (Start/Resume) L1 water Shut-0ff
L1 Alter Casing [ Fracture Treat [ Reclamation 0 wen Integrity
W] Casing Repair [J New Construction a Recomplete other Workover
O Change Plans a Plug and Abandon 0 Temporarily Abandon
O convertto Injection a Plug Back O water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones,
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in 2 muitiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once

testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Wolverine Gas and Oil Co. of Utah, LLC has determined that the Wolverine Federal 17-8 is underperforming and intends to
workover the well to improve its production. After re-perforating and acid stimulating selected Navajo intervals, an ESP will be
run and the well will be returned to production. A follow-up summary of well work activities will be filed, after work is

completed.

RECEIVED

RECEIVED

MAR 08 2013

FEB 25 2073

DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING Richfield BLM Field Office

14, I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct

Name (Printed/Typed)
Ron Meredith

Tite Senior Production Engineer

Date 02/19/201 3‘.

Signature ( A

Approved by

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease

which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title Date

Office

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction. ‘

(Instructions on reverse)

| | ~
Sere M 12 cracozzs Accepted For Record Purpose |




Sundry Nunber: 36961 APl Well Nunber: 43041300470000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

FORM 9

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU 73528

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WOLVERINE

1. TYPE OF WELL
Oil Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WOLVERINE FED 17-8

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
WOLVERINE GAS & OIL COMPANY OF UTAH, LLC

9. API NUMBER:
43041300470000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
One Riverfront Plaza 55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI, 49503

PHONE NUMBER:
616 458-1150 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
COVENANT

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:

2020 FSL 1602 FWL

COUNTY:
SEVIER

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 17 Township: 23.0S Range: 01.0W Meridian: S

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

l:‘ ACIDIZE

l:‘ CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS

l:‘ ALTER CASING

l:‘ NOTICE OF INTENT

- . I:‘ CHANGE TUBING
Approximate date work will start:

l:‘ CHANGE WELL STATUS l:‘ COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS

l:‘ DEEPEN

l:‘ OPERATOR CHANGE

J SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

4/13/2013

l:‘ FRACTURE TREAT
D PLUG AND ABANDON

l:‘ PRODUCTION START OR RESUME l:‘ RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE

l:‘ SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:
l:‘ REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION l:‘ SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

l:‘ TUBING REPAIR l:‘ VENT OR FLARE

l:‘ DRILLING REPORT

Report Date: l:‘ SI TA STATUS EXTENSION

J OTHER

l:‘ WATER SHUTOFF

l:‘ WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION

|:| CASING REPAIR

D CHANGE WELL NAME

|:| CONVERT WELL TYPE

|:| NEW CONSTRUCTION

D PLUG BACK

|:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
|:| TEMPORARY ABANDON

D WATER DISPOSAL

|:| APD EXTENSION

OTHER: IWorkover

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Wolverine completed a workover on the Wolverine Federal #17-8 on
April 13, 2013. Existing perforation intervals were re-perforated from
6209'-6218'(9') and 6246'-6256' (10') with 3-3/8", 6 spf, tubing

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

conveyed perf guns and a pressure-fire system. After guns were fired a FOR RECORD ONLY

foamed acid treatment was pumped. The treatment consisted of 2,500
gals of 7-1/2% acid foamed to 70Q, and pumped at a maximum
pressure of 4000 psi. Flushed with 90,000 SCF N2 and shut-in at 3950
psi. Flowed and swabbed back for clean-up, and recovered the entire
load volume. The well returned to production at 149 BOPD and 184

May 01, 2013

BWPD. See attached WBD and Daily Reports for additional details.

PHONE NUMBER
616 458-1150

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) TITLE

Helene Bardolph

Engineering Administrative Assistant

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
4/25/2013

RECE| VED: Apr .

25,

2013




Sundry Nunber: 36961 APl Well Nunber: 43041300470000

3/26/2013
3/27/2013

4/1/2013
4/2/2013

4/3/2013

4/4/2013

4/5/2013

4/6/2013

Covenant Field SHL NE/SW Sec 17, T23S, R1W
Federal 17-8 BHL NE/SW Sec 17, T23S, R1W
API# 43-041-30047 Sevier County, Utah

Purpose: EOB Re-Perf Two L. Navajo Zones and Acid Stimulate
Spotted frac tanks, water filtration system, BOP's and flowback equipment.

Hooked up flowback lines, laid down oil absorbent around the well head, hooked up frac tanks and filled
them with 4% KCL.

Unloaded P-110 work string onto tubing racks

MIRUSU, unloaded cat walk, rig pump and rig tank. Hooked up pump lines and assembled BOP's.

Plan to NU BOP's, pull out of hole with ESP, Pick up work string and TIH with bit and scraper, circulate well
clean and pull out of hole standing back the work string.

Opened well, 60 psi tubing, 75 psi casing. Hooked up vac truck to the casing, RU pump lines and pumped
10 bbls of completion fluid down the tubing, RD pump lines, ND wellhead, NU BOP's. RU cable spooler and
pulled out of hole with ESP equipment. Picked up and run in hole with bit, casing scraper and P-110 work
string to PBTD. RU pump lines and reverse circulated the well with 160 bbls of completion fluid. SWIFN
Opened well, 0 psi tubing, 0 psi casing. POOH with bit and casing scraper, PU and TIH with retrievable
bridge plug, retrieving head, 4' sub, HD packer, 1 joint 2 7/8" P-110 tubing, 12' P-110 tubing sub, cup type
seating nipple and 203 joints of P-110 tubing to surface. RU wireline unit to correlate the tubing measurement
to the open hole logs, this was unsuccessful due to problems with the wireline unit, RD and released wireline
company. Set the bridge plug at 6350', released off plug and set the packer at 6142' to swab all of the perf
intervals. RU swab equipment and made three swab runs, SWIFN

Plan to finish swabbing all perf intervals together

Opened well, 0 psi tubing, 0 psi casing. RU swab equipment and swabbed well as follows:

Swab runs - 8

Average rate - 222 bfpd

Total fluid recovered - 80 bbls

Perf intervals open -6178' - 6334'

RD swab equipment, RU pump lines and pumped 12 bbls of completion fluid down the tubing, RD pump lines.
Released packer, RU wireline unit and correlated to the open hole log, RD wireline unit. Reset pkr at 6230
RU swab equipment and swabbed well as follows:

Swab runs - 12

Average rate - Inconclusive due to behind pipe communication from the two perf intervals above the packer
Total fluid recovered - 58 bbls

Perf intervals open -6240' - 6334'

RD swab equipment, released plug and packer, reset plug at 6230" and packer at 6150'. SWIFN

Note: There is behind pipe communication between all perf intervals from 6240'-6344'

Opened well, 0 psi tubing, 0 psi casing. RU swab equipment and swabbed well as follows:

Swab runs - 12

Average rate - 570 bfpd

Total fluid recovered - 98 bbls

Perf intervals open -6178' - 6222

Note: The swab rates from these top two perf intervals are higher that the wells original total fluid production

Page 1 of 3 Daily Activity
RECEI VED: Apr. 25, 2013



Sundry Nunber: 36961 APl Well Nunber: 43041300470000

4/7/2013

4/8/2013

4/9/2013

4/10/2013

prior to pulling the pump.
RD swab equipment, released packer and plug, reset plug at 6350 and the packer at 6142'. RU swab equip.
and swabbed well as follows:
Swab runs - 8
Average rate - 610 bfpd
Total fluid recovered - 68 bbls
Perf intervals open -6178' - 6334
RD swab equipment and SWIFN
Opened well, 0 psi tubing, 0 psi casing. Pulled out of hole with tubing and packer, picked up tubing conveyed
perforating BHA and tripped in the hole setting the top shot on the tubing conveyed guns at 6209'. RU wireline
unit and correlated tubing measurements to the open hole logs, RD and released wireline unit. Set pkr and
pressured up the annulus to 1600 psi. RU Halliburton's nitrogen and acid equipment and pumped extreme

overbalanced perforating / acid job as follows:

Time Thg PSI Description

1924 6 Start Job - Pressure up tubing W/ N2 to fire perf guns

1949 7017 Perf guns fire - 68,842 SCF Job total

1950 3924 Start 2500 gals of 7-1/2% acid foamed to 70Q with 71,594 scf N2
2029 3729 Flush with 100% N2 - 225,877 SCF Job total

2050 3951 Shut down - 315,878 SCF Job total

2050 3949 ISIP

RD and released Halliburton acid equipment, rigged up flowback lines and flowed back 239 bbls of fluid
overnight.

Shut well in, RD flowback lines, released packer, RU pump lines and reverse circulated well with 60 bbls of
completion fluid. RD pump line and tripped out of the hole with tubing laying down packer and perf guns.
Picked up 5 1/2" HD packer and tripped in the hole setting the packer at 6135'. RU swab equipment and
swabbed the well as follows:

Swab runs - 10

Average rate - 809 bfpd

Total fluid recovered - 102 bbls

Perf intervals open -6178' - 6334'

RD swab equipment and SWIFN

Opened well, 500 psi tubing, 0 psi casing. RU flowback line and opened the well to the frac tank flowing back
9 bbls of oil. RU swab equipment and swabbed well as follows:

Swab runs - 6

Average rate - 600 bfpd (Rate may still be influenced by pockets of nitrogen from the acid job)

Total fluid recovered - 190 bbls

Perf intervals open -6178' - 6334'

RD swab equipment and SWIFN

Opened well, 400 psi tubing, 0 psi casing. RU flowback line and opened the well to the frac tank flowing back
10 bbls of oil. RU swab equipment and swabbed well as follows:

Swab runs - 6

Average rate - 615 bfpd (Rate may still be influenced by pockets of nitrogen from the acid job)

Total fluid recovered - 66 bbls

Page 2 of 3 Daily Activity
RECEI VED: Apr. 25, 2013



Sundry Nunber: 36961 APl Well Nunber: 43041300470000

Perf intervals open -6178' - 6334'

RD swab equipment, released packer and lowered retrieving head down near sand top, RU pump lines and
tubing swivel then reverse circulated sand off the top of the RBP with 55 bbls of completion fluid. RD pump
lines, released RBP and pulled out of hole with plug and packer laying down P-110 work string. RIH with one
stand and SWIFN.

4/11/2013 Opened well, 0 psi tubing, O psi casing. Pulled out of hole with kill joints, PU and RIH with Centinel, motor,
double seal section, tandem P-18 pumps, drain sub, 2 joints 2-7" tubing, cup type SN and 164 joints of 2-74"
tubing to surface. Made lower pigtail splice, ND BOP's, NU wellhead. Turned well into production.

1.5 Hour production, 30 bopd, 60 bwpd, 40 Hz, BHP 1361

4/12/2013 RDMOSU, released rig company. Roustabouts moved all of the workover equipment off location.
Final report
Supervisor: Teuy E. (ool Rig Operator:
Page 3 of 3 Daily Activity

RECEI VED: Apr. 25, 2013



Sundry Nunber

36961 API

WOLVERINE

Ground Elevation: 5,793
KB Elevation: 5,819

PBTD 8130

| 8200 <_|

PBTD 9431

9850'-10150"
12700'-12910'

Vel |

—---TOC 3250' -

Csg damage 5574-84'
---Stg tool 5671'-~

6178' - 6334

-Csg/A tool 6580*--

6630'-6632' Cement holes

---Stg tool 6816'---

Arrowset 1/w H valve
-----Pkr 7100"---~

Nunmber: 43041300470000
Wolverine Federal 17-8
APl # 43-041-30047
Covenant Field
Section 17, T23S, R1W
Sevier County, Utah
(Not to Scale)
Vertical Well
Surface: 2020' FSL 1602' FWL, NE SW, 17-23S-1W
Total Depth: ~ 2020' FSL 1602' FWL, NE SW, 17-23S-1W

Conductor Casing (06/15/07)
Size: 20", 0.25" wall

Depth Landed: 115' KB
Cement Data: Cemented to surface with 14 yds redi-mix

Surface Casing (7/04/07)
Size/Wt/Grade: 13 3/8”, 68#, J-55, STC, 8rd

Depth Landed: 1915' KB
Cement Data: 352 sks CBM light (10.5 ppg, 4.33 cf/sk), 470 sks Type V
(15.6 ppg, 1.19 cf/sk), Cemented to surface

Intermediate Casing (7/26/07
Size/Wt/Grade: 9-5/8", 47#, HCP-110, LTC, 8rd
Depth Landed: 6985' KB, stage tool @ 5671' KB
Cement Data: Stage 1- 570 sks 50:50 Poz, 14.4 ppg, 1.26 cf/sk
Stage 2- 170 sks CBM Lite, 1.5 ppg, 4.29 cf/sk
805 sks Class G, 15.8 ppg, 1.29 cf/sk

Production Casing (9/15/07 & 8/17/08)
Size/Wt/Grade: 5-1/2", 20#, L-80/HCP-110, LTC 8rd/Ultra-FJ

Properties: 9190 psi burst, 4.653" drift, 4.778" ID, 0.0221 Bbl/ft Capacity
Depth Landed: 9524' KB
Stage tool: (Weatherford POST 781) @ 6816' KB
Splice: Cut & realigned @ 6580' KB, squeeze holes at 6630'- 6632' KB
Cement Data: 425 sks 50:50 Poz, 13.4 ppg, 1.8 cf/sk (9/15/07)

660 sks Class “G”, 15.8 ppg, 1.15 cf.sk (8/19/08)

Navajo Perforations

6178~ 6188’ MD (6178~ 6188’ TVD), 10’, 60 holes  (9/19/08)
6202~ 6222' MD (6202*- 6222’ TVD), 20", 120 holes  (9/19/08)
6209'- 6218' MD (6209'- 6218’ TVD) Re-perf existing intervals (4/07/13)
6240~ 6260’ MD (6240™- 6260’ TVD), 20", 120 holes  (9/12/08)
6246'- 6256' MD (6246'- 6256' TVD), Re-perf existing intervals (4/07/13)
6276- 6291' MD (6276 6291’ TVD), 15, 90 holes  (9/12/08)
6311~ 6334’ MD (6311~ 6334’ TVD), 23’, 138 holes  (9/06/08)

Mid-Perf = 6256' MD (6256' TVD), 88' M (88.0' TV), 528 holes

Tubing (8/30/2011) (see Page 2 for details)

End of BHA 5351' WLM (5351' TVD)
Centinel 5347 WLM (5347 TVD)
Pump intake  5323' WLM (5323' TVD)

Seating Nipple 5216' WLM (5216' TVD)

TEC 4/11/2013

RECEI VED: Apr. 25, 2013



Sundry Nunber: 36961 APl Well Nunber: 43041300470000

WOLVERINE Wolverine Federal 17-8
APl # 43-041-30047

Covenant Field

Section 17, T23S, R1W

Sevier County, Utah

PBTD

(08/23/11) 7080' - Tubing tag with wireline correction
(08/05/08) 7080' - WL tag of sand plug

(02/13/08) 8130' - WL tag

(02/11/08) 8200' - CICR (tubing set)

(01/23/08) 9378' - CBL logger depth

(09/15/07) 9431' - Float Collar

Tubing Detail (4/11/2013)
26.00 KB
-2.00 Landed above GL
164 5193.97 Tubing - 2-7/8", 6.5#, N-80, EUE, 8rd
1 1.10 Cup type SN
2 63.43 Tubing - 2-7/8", 6.5#, N-80, EUE, 8rd
1 0.48 Drain sub
1 0.50 Discharge
1 20.50 Pump
1 20.70 Pump
1 6.10 Seal
1 6.10 Seal
1 12.10 Motor
1 4.10 Downhole pressure sensor, Centinel llI
-2.0 Wireline correction
5351.08' EOT (5351' KB MD-WLM, 5351' TVD)
Note: No check valve in this well.
Tubing capacity = 0.00579 Bbl/ft, Burst = 10570 psi, Joint Yield = 144960 Ibs

Twin Creek Perforations

7996' - 8008' MD (7996' — 8008' TVD), 12', 48 holes (2/13/08)
8014' - 8026' MD (8014' — 8026' TVD), 12', 48 holes (3/29/08)
8050' - 8070" MD (8050' — 8070' TVD), 20', 80 holes (2/13/08)
8088' - 8108' MD (8088' — 8108’ TVD), 20', 80 holes (2/13/08)

Mid-Perf = 8052' MD (8052' TVD), 64' M (64.0' TV), 256 holes

Wellhead Information
- Tubing head flange is 7-1/16", 5M with a 2-7/8" EUE 8rd top connection.

Stimulation
-04/07/13 Acidized all perf intervals with, 2,500 gals of 7¥2% FeX2 (w/ 2 gpt HAI-404M corrosion inhibitor, 8
gpt AQF-2 foaming agent, and 5 gpt Pen-88M surfactant, and 5 gpt AS-5 anti-sludge), foamed to 70Q.
- 08/26/11 Pumped 5000 gallons of 7-%2% FE HCL w/ 250 buoyant balls into all Navajo perf intervals
- 09/24/08 All perforated Navajo intervals broken down using completion fluid and ball sealers during completion.

Notes
Surface Location: Latitude = 38.78729, Longitude = -111.93382
(1/23/08) Original top of Cement behind 5-%2" @ 7003’
(1/28/08) Cement squeezed leaking POST with 30 sks micromatrix cement.
(10/7/08): Available Logs: Halliburton- DLL/MSFL, HRI, SDL/DSN, MRIL
Schlumberger- AIT/TLD/HGNS/MCFL, All/GR, BHC/GR, CBL, Isolation Scan
Weatherford & Baker Atlas- caliper logs

TEC 4/11/2013
RECEI VED: Apr. 25, 2013
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