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WESTERNLANDSERVICES

August 5, 2004

Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
1594 W. N. Temple Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

RE: Wolverine Gas & Oil Company of Utah, LLC requests permission to drill the
Wolverine Federal #20-1 well as an exception to Rule R649-3-3

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to Rule R649-3-3 of the State's Oil & Gas Conservation regulations, Wolverine
Gas & Oil Company of Utah, LLC, hereby makes application for approval to
directionally drill an oil & gas well.

Wolverine Gas & Oil Company of Utah, LLC (Wolverine) proposes to drill the
Wolverine Federal #20-1 well to a total depth of 7,050 feet. Wolverine is the only
operator within a 460 foot radius.

The mountainous terrain of the area is such that directional drilling is the most effective
method to minimize surface disturbance. By locating the well pad on a relatively flat
surface and drilling a directional well beneath this challenging topography, Wolverine
can most effectively minimize surface disturbance and ensure proper utilization of
resources.

Attached hereto is a plat as required by the Commissions rules and regulations.

If no objections are filed, the applicant requests that this application be approved. If
objections are filed, applicant requests the matter be set for hearing and that it be advised
of the hearing date.

Respectfully submitted,

Wolverine Gas Company of Utah, LLC

Authoriz Agent

WESTERN LAND SERVICES - UTAH
310 South 100 East • Richfield, UT 84701 • Phone: (435) 896-1943 • Fax: (435) 893-2134

Web:



CimElDENTIAL
STATEOFUTAH e FoRM 3

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

ÛÛÅ DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS ANDMINING AMENDEDREPORT O
(highlight changes)

APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILL y, ggÇ3¶(
EASENO FACE

1A.TYPEOFWORK DRILL REENTER O DEEPEN
7 IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

8. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:

B. TYPE OF WELL: OIL GAS O OTHER SINGLE ZONE MULTIPLEZONEO Wolverine Fed. Exploration Unit

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC Wolverine Federal #20-1

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

One Riverfront Plaza city Grand Rapids STATE ZIP 49503 (616) 458-1150 Wildcat
4. LOCATIONOF WELL(FOGTAGES) 11. QT10GTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

MERIDIAN:

ATSURFACE: 833' FSL & 1,925' FWL - T23S-R1W, Sec 17 NWNW 20 23S 1W

AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONe 660' FNL & 660' FWL - T23S-R1W,Sec 20 go ¡QQ
14. DISTANCE IN MILESAND DIRECT10NFROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY 13. STATE

4.2 mile South of Sigurd Sevier
UTAH

15. DISTANCETO NEAREST PROPERTYOR LEASE UNE (FEET) 16. NUMBEROF ACRES IN LEASE 17. N IMBEROF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:

appr. 400' 8,236 ac 40

18. DISTANCETO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING,COMPLETED,OR 19. PROPOSED DEFTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:

APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET}

appr. 15' 7,050 BLM# WY 3329
21. ELEVATIONS(SHOW WHETHER OF, RT, GR, ETC.) 22. APPROXIMATEDATEWORK WILLSTART: 23. EST1MATEDDURATION:

GR-5,835· 9/15/2004 40 days

24. PROPOSED CASING ANDCEMENTINGPROGRAM

SIZEOF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE,AND WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTlNG OEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTfTY,YlELD,ANDSLURRYWEIGHT

20 14 80 Conductor

12 1/2 9 5/8 36 ppf J55 STC 1,510 lead:c,360sx,1.78, 12.8/tail:g, 280sx,1.20, 15.6

8 3/4 5 1/2 17 ppf LSOLTC 7,250 lead:Poz, 750sx,1.76, 13.0/tail:Poz, 350sx,1.49, 13.4

AUG- b2004

26. ATTACHMENTS

VERIFYTHE FOLLØiNINGARE ATTACHEDINACCORDANCEWITHTNE UTAHOILANDGAS CONSERVATIONGENERALRULES:

WELL PLATOR MAPPREPARED BY UCENSED SURVEYOROR ENGINEER COMPLETEDRILLINGPLAN

O EVIDENCEOF DIVISIONOF WATER RIGHTS APPROVALFOR USE OF WATER FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANYØTHER THANTHE LEASE OWNER

NAME(PLEASE NT) TIRE ViCO PTOSident, Land & Legal

31GNAfdRE DATE

API NUMBERASSIGNED: APPROVAL:

Utah Division of - /¡



WOLVERINEGAS & OIL CORP.T23S, Ri W, S. L.B. &M• Well location, WOLVERINEFEDERAL#20-1,
located as shown in the SE 1/4 SW 1/4 ofNB912'W - 5210.04' (G.L.o.) Section 17, T23S, R1W, S.L.B.&M., Sevier County,Utah.

BASISOF ELEVATION
SPOT ELEVATIONLOCATEDNEARA ROAD IN THE SW 1/4 OFSECTION17, T23S, R1W, S.LB.&M., TAKENFROM THE SIGURDQUADRANGLE,UTAH, SEVIERCOUNTY,7.5 MINUTESERIES
(TOPOGRAPHICALMAP) PUBLISHEDBY THE UNITED STATESDEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR,GEOLOGICALSURVEY. SAIDELEVATIONIS MARKEDAS BEING 5774 FEET.

o
o

N

17 8FM7 &ass Chp
-

Lot i IP mm mang ... .... ................
: SCALE

CERTIFICA 44 It
¯¯

WGiVER/NEFEDERÆ./20- ni NOWSOF C BY
Elev. Graded Ground = 581' off Q ""

-
" * I

Ïi25 Lot 2

7 gy REVISED:7-7-04
maf Nyt scouared REVISED:5-27-04

ß7°28'29"E -

2457.84• (ygs) SS7'34'W -

2460.48° (G.L.O.)
UINTAB WGINEERING & laAND G

86 SOUTH 200 BAST - VÆRNAI. UFAB 84078
(435) 789-1017BASIS OF BEARINGSLEGEND: seAu oAm sunswo oAm onAm:BASIS OF BEARINGSIS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION. 1" - 1000 3-4-04 3-10-04L - so·SYMBOL (AUTONOMOUSNAD83) PARTf RORDICES

G.O. D.J. C.G. G.LO. PLATO - PROPOSED WELLHEAD. LATlTUDE= 38'47'51.11" (38.797531) wAmen nuA = SECTIONCORNERSLOCATED. LONGITUDE= 111'56'05.06" (111.934739) COOL WOLVERINEGAS & OIL



CONRDENTIAL

PROJECT PLAN OF DEVELOPMENT AND
MASTER SURFACE USE PLAN

Wolverine FEDERAL#241

NAME OF APPLICANT: Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah,
LLC
One Riverfront Plaza, 55 Campau NW
Grand Rapids, Michigan 49503-2616

PROJECT NAME: "Wolverine Federal #20-1"
NWINW of Section 20
Township 23 South - Range l West

ATTACHMENTS: A.) Project Map/Survey
B.) Well Site Location Layout
C.) Cross Sections (Cut and Fill)
D.) Wildlife & Vegetative Species of

Concern Summary
E.) Cultural Resource Survey Report

I. DESCRIPTION OF PROJECT:

Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC (Wolverine) proposes to drill and

explore for hydrocarbons, using a directional drilling program, from the Navajo
Formation at depths of approximately 4,810' - 7,036' and approximately 8,062' - 9,100'
within the Wolverine Federal Exploration Unit situated in Sevier County, Utah:

TOWNSHIP 23 SOUTH, RANGE 1 WEST

Northvvest Quarterof Northwest Quarter(NW/NW) of Section 20
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Project Plan of Deve Moment & Surface UsePlan DENTIAL
Wolverine Gas & Oie ompany of Utah, LLC
Wolverine Federal #20-1

Well Name & No. Target Elev. Location TD Footages

LEASE#UIU73528
MblwriæFederal#20-1 Navajol and2 5,835' NWNWSec20,'123S-R1W 7,050' 840'FSE¿l,916'FSL

The attached Project Map (Attachment A) indicates the proposed well site and its
intended configuration. Additionally, the existing access route is indicated. This well is

being drilled within the "Wolverine Federal Exploration Unit" and upon federally owned

surface administered by the Bureau of Land Management, United States Department of

the Interior.

Mineral rights within the Wolverine Federal Exploration Unit are owned by a

variety of interests and are federally owned at the target bottom-hole location for this
proposed well. The proposed surface plan will be reviewed and inspected by the
appropriate regulatory agencies, state and federal, to ensure proper utilization of the
surface reflecting an effort by Wolverine to minimize surface disturbance and waste.

Appropriate Onshore Oil and Gas Orders and those of the Utah Division of Oil, Gas and

Mining will be followed in the constructing, drilling, completion, operation, plugging and

surface reclamation of this well.

The project is situated within an area that is referred to by the Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining (Statement of Basis, Kings Meadow Ranches 17-1, October 21,

2003) as "... placed in the High Plateaus section of the Colorado Plateau physiographic
province in western central Utah. Some people have characterized this area as being in

the Basin and Range - Colorado Plateau transition zone." The drill site itself is located in

a flat area between steep hills and is contiguous to Highway 24 from which access to this
site will be established. The flat area is dominated by sagebrush - grass communities and

the nearby hillsides are dominated by Pinyon Pine - Juniper communities. The access

route consists of an improved driveway off from Highway 24 entering onto the existing

well site. BLM road construction standards will be adhered to as new improvements are
constructed.

Wolverine's proposed "Wolverine Federal #20-1" project is most easily accessible

from Sigurd, Utah. From Sigurd, one would drive down Highway 24 heading
east/southeasterly. At mile marker 14, drive approximately 0.2 miles and turn westerly

onto the access road heading onto the well site. Drive approximately 100 yards to the
proposed well pad location.

Surface water is located in the area primarily in the form of the Sevier River, in

the Peterson Creek drainage, a tributary of Brine Creek. Local springs arising from the
volcanic rocks and ephemeral drainages also exist in the area including a drainage way
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Project Plan of Deve',ment & Surface UsePlan NRDB
Wolverine Gas & Oitompany of Utah, LLC -

Wolverine Federal #20-1

situated along Highway 24. The Sevier River is approximately three (3) miles west of

this proposed location.

Geology and Soil Types

Again quoting from the "Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, Statement of Basis,
Kings Meadow Ranches 17-1", the well "...will likely spud into a thin alluvium covering
the evaporate-rich Jurassic age Arapien shale." "The Arapien Shale may have been
somewhat intruded or elevated into the area between the Sevier Fault and the
considerable parallel secondary faulting mapped in the Cedar Mountain - Black
Mountain area..." It is anticipated that from surface to approximately 400 feet in depth,
the lithology of the Quaternarywill consist of unconsolidated sediments.

The soil type classified at the Wolverine Federal #20-1 wellsite is the Billings

silty clay loam. This soil type is a fine-silty, mixed calcareous, mesic Typic Torrifluvents

and is usually found in areas containing two (2) to five (5) percent slopes. The soil is a

deep, drained, silty clay loam. It features a light gray, moderately alkaline, strongly
calcareous, silty clay loam surface soil that is approximately ten (10) inches thick. The
subsoils consist of a light gray, moderately alkaline, friable, silty clay loam approximately

32 inches thick. The substrate material is a light gray, moderately alkaline, friable, silty
clay loam with a small amount of gypsum veining.

Assuming that the drilling and completion of this well results in its ability to
commercially produce hydrocarbons, appropriate market connections will be made upon

proper permitting of such activities by all agencies having jurisdictionover said activities.

II. SOIL EROSION CONTROL MEASURES:

The well pad was sloped at about 1%, in the direction of the site's drainage so as

to provide for a well-drained work area during drilling operations. Appropriate collection

and infiltration basins were constructed in the sloped area of the drill pad.

In all fill areas, the edges were diked to control run off.

Appropriate drill site drainage and sedimentation control measures were
incorporated in the operational plan. These included utilization of earthen dikes along the
fill portion of the drilling pad perimeter, stabilization of slopes as needed, location of the
reserve pits in the cut portion of the drilling pad and the pad constructed so as to slope

toward a collection and infiltration basin. Construction of the drill site was in accordance
with the regulations and stipulations as defined by the State of Utah, Department of
Natural Resources, Division of Water Rights.

Reclamation of the site was in accordance with Best Management Practices and

requirements of the Bureau of Land Management.

Page 3 of



Project Plan of Devebment & Surface Use Plan CONR)
Wolverine Gas & Oitompany of Utah, LLC -

Wolverine Federal #20-1

III. EXISTING ACCESS ROADS AND ROAD IMPROVEMENTS

The existing access road is identified and labeled on the project map. Steep,
rough topography is not identified as a problem along our access route which was
constructed by initially using fill material and covering it with approximately eight (8)
inches of shale/gravel. Another layer of road base material, approximately four (4) inches
in depth, was placed on top of the shale/gravel.

IV. LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS

The recently drilled "King Meadow Ranches 17-1" well is situated approximately
one-half mile northerly of this proposed well site location and is situated in the Southeast
Quarterof the Northwest Quarter(SEINW)of Section 17, Township 23 South, Range 1

West, Sevier County, Utah. "Wolverine Federal 17-2" is located approximately 15 feet
West of this proposed well site and is situated in the Southeast Quarterof the Southwest
Quarter(SE/SW) of Section 17, Township 23 South, Range 1 West, Sevier County,Utah.

V. DRILLING METHOD

Wolverine proposes to use a directional drilling program for the Wolverine
Federal #20-1. The mountainous terrain of the area is such that directional drilling is the
most efficient method to minimize surface disturbance. By locating the well pad on a
relatively flat surface, and drilling a directional well beneath this challenging topography,
Wolverine can most effectively minimize surface disturbance and ensure proper
utilization of resources.

VI. LOCATION AND TYPE OF WATER SUPPLY

Water for drilling the Wolverine Federal #20-1 will be purchased from water
wells nearby or drilled on location and pumped into storage tanks at the site. Water for
drilling from nearby well(s) will be hauled to or pumped on location and stored in storage

tanks on the drill site. Wastewater will not be discharged on the surface at this site and

the drilling of the well will not require a wastewater management plan.

VII. CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

In most circumstances, natural earth materials were used for the construction of
roads and fills. These were taken from locations essentially contiguous to or nearby the
locations to be improved. When necessary, road base materials were used and delivered
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ProjectPlanofDeve' oment &Surface UsePlan $9NFIDENTIAL
Wolverine Gas & Oiwompany of Utah, LLC -

Wolverine Federal #20-1

by the contractor for application on site and specifically as the initial fill material for the
access road, which was then covered with approximately eight (8) inches of shale/gravel.

VIII. METHODS FOR HANDLING WASTE

The Reserve Pit was constructed on the well pad per the attached Well Site
Location Layout (Attachment B). It will be used for the disposal of waste mud and drill
cuttings and is located on the west/southwesterly portion of the well site plan. The pit

dimensions are 125 feet X 225 feet and will be 10 feet deep. The pit was lined with a

synthetic liner having a minimum thickness of 12 mills. Rules pursuant to R649-3-16

will be followed regarding the reserve pit as well as those governing Onshore Oil and Gas
Operations (43 CFR 3160.)

Upon evaporation of fluids, pit closure occurs with the back fill of soil and its
compaction to prevent settling. The usage of the pit is further described in the section

VIII under pit closure.

All garbage will be taken off site and disposed of properly. Pursuant to R649-3-

14, all rubbish and debris shall be kept in containers on the well site, and will be hauled
to an approved disposal site upon completion of drilling and completion operations and as

needed during such operations. There will be no chemical disposal of any type. Sewage
is handled through the renting of portable toilets. These are serviced by the rental

company and removed from site when no longer required.

IX. PLANS FOR RECLAMATION OF THE SURFACE

Pit closure: The pits will be fenced on three sides during all drilling operations

and then the fourth side will be immediatelyfenced when the rig is moved off location.
After evaporation of fluids, back-fill of sub-soil and compaction to prevent settling will
occur within 90 days of the drilling and completing of the well. If necessary after 90
days, the fluids will be sucked out of the pit and transported off site.

The topsoil was stripped off and stock piled in an area not to be disturbed. The

topsoil will be placed back on the pit after back filling and then prepped for re-seeding.

The approximate Pit size is indicated on the Well Site Location Layout diagram

attached hereto (Attachment B).

Revegetation Methods: Disturbed areas will be disked, seeded and "dragged", as

needed; seeding with a mixture approved by the local USDA Natural Resource
Conservation Service or the Bureau of Land Management.

Wolverine generally requires at least twelve (12) pounds per acre of seed
distribution. Wolverine suggests that autumn seeding practices be used due to the terrain
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Project Plan of Deve ,ment & Surface Use Plan
WolverineGas & Oittompany of Utah, LLC -

Wolverine Federal #20-1

in this project area. Spring rain events are common and tend to cause severe run-off. Fall
seeding will allow any moisture, whether rain or snow, to assist the seed into the ground.

Other Practices: Other practices that will be utilized to reclaim disturbed areas

will include riprap when and if necessary to prevent erosion and the installation of silt

fencing in sensitive and/or erosive areas.

Timetable: Reclamation of the surface will commence as soon thereafter
construction, drilling and well completion are concluded, as is practicable, depending on

weather. In the event of a dry hole, the drill site and roadways will be restored to their
original condition as nearly as practicable within 180 days after plugging date of the well.

X. SURFACE OWNERSHIP

The surface of the proposed well site is federally owned and is administered by
the Bureau of Land Management, United States Department of Interior.

XI. WELLSITE LAYOUT

Please see the attached "Well Site Location Layout" (Attachment B) for the well

configurations.

XII. PIPELINES AND STREAM CROSSINGS

PIPELINES: In the event of hydrocarbon production requiring transmission by
pipeline, the proposed pipeline(s) will be designed, constructed, tested, operated and

maintained in accordance with standard safety practices and by a combination of
construction techniques intended to minimize to the greatest extent practical the impacts
upon natural resources.

Pipelines will typically be installed by trenching. In these trenched areas, the
contractor shall strip and stockpile topsoil to be replaced over the backfill portion upon

completion of construction operations. Silt fencing will be installed at all stream

crossings.

The proposed pipelines will be constructed with a combination of methods

intended to minimize impacts to private, state and federally owned property, county roads

and natural resources. The pipeline will be constructed by a combination of conventional

construction techniques and special measures designed to minimize impacts to natural

resources. Pipelines will be adequately compacted before the topsoil is replaced for re-

seeding.
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Project Plan of Deve' onent & Surface Use Plan $9NRDEM
Wolverine Gas & Oiltompany of Utah, LLC
Wolverine Federal #20-1

In general and where required, soil erosion control measures will consist of

appropriate BMPs (Best Management Practices) to reduce the potential for erosion. The
BMPs that will be utilized in upland areas include use of construction barriers where

appropriate, land clearing, spoil piles, staging and scheduling, seeding and mulching.

Note that spoil piles will not typically be seeded since exposure of the spoil piles should

be minimal in time. All other proper BMP measures will be implemented to reduce the
potential for erosion. Seeding of all raw soils after burial of pipe will be performed.

However, mulching will be performed only within state or county road right-of-ways.

Generally speaking, in wetlands, appropriate BMPs will be implemented to
minimize the potential for soil erosion and point source pollution within wetland

construction zones. These measures shall include, but not be limited to, clearing, barriers,

staging, filters, silt fencing, spoil piles, dewatering, seeding, and mulching.

XIII. GENERAL

TIMELINE: The following is a general order of construction and sequence of

earth change by which our operations will proceed:

1.) Access Road and Well Pad Construction

2.) Drilling and Well Completion Operations

3.) Initial Well Pad Restoration

4.) Clearing of Pipeline Rights-of-way (if needed)

5.) Delivery and Layout of Pipe

6.) Pipe Welding and Inspection

7.) Trenching of Pipe

8.) Placement and Burying of Pipe

9.) Final Restoration of Site/Access/Pipeline Route

10.) Re-Seeding

All hillsides, creek banks, and other places where contractor has moved earth to
facilitate operations shall be restored to as near original condition as practical. Replaced

material and/or backfill will be protected from erosion to the satisfaction of Wolverine,
the Bureau of Land Management and the Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining without

undue delay.
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Project Plan of Devel ment & Surface UsePlan ÛÑI
Wolverine Gas & Oil e-ompany of Utah, LLC
WolverineFederal #20-1

Upon completion of any backfill, contractor shall clear pipeline rights-of-way and

access routes of large rocks, stumps and other debris; fill holes, ruts and depressions, and

shall keep the access road in a neat and acceptable condition. All cleanup shall be
maintained by the contractor until final acceptance by Wolverine and the enforcing
agency.

XIV. ENVIRONMENTAL IMPACT ASSESSMENT:

It is anticipated that the drilling and operations planned, provided the success of

this well, will not have any adverse affects to any wildlife or aquatic life in the area.

There will be only a minor effect on the surface cover. Drilling and production operations

should have minimal effect on the population patterns, land use, public utilities or public

services in the near future for this rural area.

Noise levels during drilling and completion operations may be continuous but not

unusually high. If production is achieved, noise levels should be minimal during the
operation and maintenance of the wells.

Necessary soil erosion and sedimentation safeguards will be built into the well

pad, access andfuture proposed pipeline routes to protect any nearby lowlands, where

appropriate. Particular care will be exercised in order that all drain ditches be maintained

and kept unobstructed to prevent water backup against spoil banks or backfill, causing

erosion. The cumulative long-term effect on the immediate environment should be
minimal.

If the well is productive, the effect on the air quality in the area is expected to be
practically non-existent. Human activity in this area is somewhat limited, due to the
nature of the location. Ranching operations and any activities in the area should not be

adversely affected.

The site will then be contoured as closely as practical to its natural state, fine

graded and stabilized. The well site and access route will be restored as soon as practical.

If a well is productive, existing dikes will be maintained and erosion control procedures,

as specified and required by the Bureau of Land Management, will be followed to insure

protection of the local ecosystem.

Cultur al

Please see, "Attachment E", Cultural Resource of A Well Pad and Access Route

Near Sigurd, Sevier County, Utah.
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Project Plan of Devel tent & Surface UsePlan '

Wolverine Gas & Oil Cömpanyof Utah, LLC
WolverineFederal #20-1

Wildlife

Please see "Attachment D", a summary of Wildlife and Vegetative Species of
Concern.

XV. SUMMARY:

In conclusion, the environmental impact of this project is considered to be
minimal and every effort will be made to ensure the protection and preservation of the
environment, as well as the standard of living for those affected by its operation.

This proposed project is aimed at increasing the hydrocarbon reserves within the
State of Utah. In addition, in the event that production can be established in this project,
it will be of financial benefit to the private holders of oil and gas rights within the
"Wolverine Federal Exploration Unit", including the Bureau of Land Management in
fulfillment of its stewardship responsibilities over federally owned oil and gas assets. We
consider the environmental impact of this project to be slight and we will make every
effort to be conscientious operators and to insure protection and preservation of the
environment during the course of our drilling and producing operations.

Sincerely,

Wolverine G a d Oil Compa y f Utah, LC

By:
S urd

Authorized Permitting Agent:

Western Land Services - Western Division
54 West Seymour Street
Sheridan, WY 82801
Donald L. Anderson, Chief Operating Officer
Phone: 307-673-1817
Local Contact: Shawn Burd
Phone: 435-896-1943
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I State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL REbetJRCES
Division of Water Rights

OLENE S. WALKER ROBERT L MORGAN JERRY D.OLDS
Governor Executive Director State Engineer/Division Director

GAYLE F. McKEACHNIE
Lieutenant Governor

April 12, 2004

Kings Meadow Ranches
C/O Mack Dastrup
P.O. Box 570125
Sigurd, UT 84657

RE: TEMPORARY CHANGE APPLICATION
t28851

Dear Sir:

The above numbered Temporary Change Application has been approved

subject to prior rights and the following condition:

* The total amount of water diverted from Kings

Meadow Creek will be limited to 14.0 acre-feet

of water for uses associated with gas well

drilling from May 30, 2004 to May 30, 2005.

The historically irrigated land totaling 4.667

acres will not be irrigated.

Copies are herewith returned to you for your records and future

reference.

re y

Kirk Forbush, P.E.

Regional Engineer
for Jerry Olds, State Engineer

JO/KF/cr
enclosure

Southern Region, Richtield Oflice, 130 N N1am streeL I'() 109, sta Richtichi. \ l 84701-0563

telephone (435) 896-4429 • facsimile (435) 893-81 14 • nun utneroglus umh



APPLIC-TION FOR TEMPL,RARY CHANGE
OF WATFA,,,,,,gs., «

Fec Paid 5 ]_5 . e

STATEOF UTAHAPR7 -. 2004Re<:cip •&

Microfilmed
RICHRELOAREA2.5 I fo RolI#

ForthepurposcofobtainingpermissiontomakeatemporarychangeofwaterintheStateofUtah,applicationis
herebymadetotheStateEngineer,baseduponthefollowingshowingoffacts,submittedinaccordancewiththe
requirements of Soclion 73-3-3Utah Code Annotated 1953, as amended.

'WATER RIGHT NO 2529 .-APPUCATION NO. t 28851.
Changes are proposed in (check those applicable)

x point of diversion. place of use. nature of use. × period of use.
1. OWNER INFORMATION

Name: Kings Meadow Ranches - Evan DastruP Interest: _%
Address LO. Box 116

. Sigurd State. Utah 7¡p (;ode. 84657

2. PRIORITY OF CHANGE:' 4/7/04 "FluNG DATE: 477704

A Portion 6/½2529
5. RIGHT EVIDENCED BY .

PriorApprovedTompararyChangeApplicationsforthieright-

1. QUANTITY OF WATER: cfs and/or 14 ac-ft.

5. SOURCE ings Meadow Creek

6. COUNTY: Sevier

7. POINT(S) OF DIVERSION: S 1, 011' , E 1, 711' from NW corner of
Section 28, T23S, R1W

Dest:ription of Diverting Works: Kings Meadow Creek

8. POINT(S) OF REDIVERSION
The waler has been rediverted from at a point:

Descript inn of Diverling Works:

9. POINT(S) OF RETURN
The amount al water consumed is _ cís or acdl.
The amount of water returned is cís or ac-tt.
The waior has been returned to the natural stream/source at a point(s):

These items are 10 be completed by the Division of Water Rights.

Temporarv



10. NATURE AND PERIOD OF UE
Irrigation: From 0-01 to 10/31

Stockwatering: From 01/01 to 12/31

Domestic: From 01/01 to 12/31

Municipal: From to
Mining: from to
Power: From to
Other: From to

11. PURPOSE AND EXTENTOF USE
Irrigation: 4 . 6 67 acres. Sole supply of acres.
Stockwatering (number and kindþ
Domestic: Families and/or _

Persons.
Municipal (name):
Mining· Mining District in the Mina

Ores mined·
Power· Plant name: Type- Capacity

ther (descriheþ

12. PLACEOF USE
Legal description of place of use by 40 acre tract(s): Section 20 , T23S, RlW, SE/4 , SLBM

13. STORAGE
Reservoir Name: Storage Period: from . to .

Capacily: ac-ft. Inundated Area: acres.
Height of dam: leet.
Legal description of inundated area by 40 tract(s]·

eue se esaus **** * THEFOLLOWINGCHANGESAREPROPOSED eeeeeeeeeee eeeeeeeee

14. QUANTITY OF WATER:._ cís and/or"' 14 ac-ft.

15. SOURCE: Kings Meadow Creek

13alance of the water will be abandoned: , or will be used as heretofore:

16. COUNTY: Sevier

17 POINT(S)OFDIVERSION: S 869', W 1,901' from SW corner of Section 17,
T23S, RlW, SLBM

Description of Diverting Works:
"COMMON DESCRIPTION:

18. POINT(S) OF REDIVERSION
The water will he rediverted from at a point

Description of Diverting Works:

19. POINT(S) OF RETURN
The amount of water to be consumed is cls or ac-ft.

The amount of water 10 be returned is cfs or ac-ft.

The water will be returned to the natural stream/source at a



20 NATURE AND PERIOD OF ' "

Irrigation: From2. to
Stockwatering: From _ __/ to
Domest ic: From _ to

Municipal: From to

Mining: From to

Power: From _ / to
Other: From05__f30 0_Lio OL30__/_0_5

21. PURPOSE AND EXTENTOF USE
Irrigalion acres. Sole supply of acres.
Sinckwalerin numher and kind)

Domeslie: Families and/or Persons.

Municipal (name)
Mining: Mining District at the Mino.

Ores mined:
Power: Plant name: Type: Capacity:

Olher (descrihe) Use water for gas well drilling

22. PLACE OF USE
Legal description of place of use by 40 acre tract(s).,,Section 17, T23S, RlW, SE/SW, SLBM

25. STORAGE
Reservoir Name Storage Period: from to

Capacil y: ._

ac-ft. Inundated Area: acres.

Iloight of dum: 601.

Legal description ol inundated area by 40 tract(s):

24. EXPLANATORY

The following is set forth 10 define more clearly the full purposeof this application. Include any suppfomental

water rights used for the same purpose. (Use additional pages of same size il necessary)
Mack Dastrup (435) 896-5206 Kenneth Dastrup (435) 896-8759

P.O. Box 570125 P.O. Box 570056

Sigurd, Utah 84657 Sigurd, Utah 84657

The undersigned hereby acknowledges that even though he/she/they may have been assisted in the preparat lon

al the above-numbered application through the courtesy of the employees of the Division of Water Rights, all

responsibiliiv for the accuracy of the information contained herein, at the time of liling, rests with the

Signature of



ONRDENTIAL

Wolverine Federal #20-1

The Wolverine Federal #20-1 wellsite is located approximately 4.2 miles southeast of the
town of Sigurd in Township 23 South - Range 1 West, Section 20: Northwest Quarterof

the Northwest Quarter(NW/NW) Salt Lake Base and Meridian in Sevier County, Utah.

The proposed Wolverine Federal #20-1 is situated adjacent to Highway 24 in a gentle

rolling plains with hilly terrain on the west side. Plant habitat types within the area

consist of a combination of Pinyon Pine- Juniper, located on the hillsides, and sagebrush
- grass communities in the less gradient areas.

THE PROPOSED ACTIONS

The proposed depth is 7,050 feet for the Wolverine Federal #20-1 well. The well pad

dimensions will be approximately 300 feet by 325 feet. The access road was constructed

by initially using fill material and covering it with approximately 8 inches of shale/gravel.

Another layer of road base material, approximately 4 inches in depth, will be placed on

top of the shale/gravel.

WILDLIFE AND VEGETATIVE SPECIES OF CONCERN

Potential effects concerning federally endangered, threatened, proposed, candidate,
sensitive, and management indicator wildlife and vegetative species has been evaluated in
the proposed area of disturbance before any surface disturbing activities have occurred.

It is understood that these activities and the proposed location will be monitored by a

BLM staff or approved biologist. A habitat analysis has been completed to evaluate

which species may occur in the area. Surface use guidelines will be followed as will

surface use restrictions and time limit stipulations in the area of concern for all affected

species.

It is understood that the Wolverine Federal #20-1 wellsite is situated within a designated
critical deer wintering range. Proposed activities are not anticipated to occur during any

such wintering range seasonal restrictions. There is also the possibility that small clumps

of Penstemon plants may be located within this project area. Wolverine Gas and Oil
Company of Utah, LLC will take all necessary steps to protect the species of concern and

as stipulated by the Bureau of Land
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Cultural Resource Inventory of A Well Pad and Access Route Near Sigurd, Sevier
County, Utah

Jason Bright
Mountain States Archaeology

7190 South State Street
Midvale, Utah 84047

Project Number U-04-MV-0262b
BLM Permit UTO380011

April 5,



ONRDENTIAL
Cultural Resource Inventory of A WellPad and Access Route Near Sigurd, Sevier

County,Utah

Project Description

In March 2004, Western Land Services contracted Mountain States Archaeology
to perform Class III cultural resource inventory of a small well pad and access route in
Sevier County, Utah on behalf of Wolverine Oil and Gas.

The wellpad and access route are located in Township 23 South Range 1 West,
SW Section 17 (Figure 1). A records search was performed for this project on March 2,
2004 at Utah SHPO. Upon returning the BLM Project Authorization, Craig Harmon at
the Richfield BLM office forwarded records search information on March 26*, 2004.
Fieldwork was completed March 28*2004.

Records Search
The SHPO records search foundno previously completed inventoriesor

previously recorded sites within one mile of the well pad. The records search
information provided by Craig Harmon (Richfield Field Office, BLM) foundonly
U89BL464 which was the Sigurd/Kings Meadow Power Line. No sites were found on
this project.

Methods
The parcel and access route were staked out prior to fieldwork. A crew of two

inventoried the access route with one individual walking its staked centerline from
Highway 24 to the well pad with another individual 15 meters south and west of the
centerline, and walked back to the road along the centerline with an individual 15 meters
to the north and east. Thus, the centerline was walked twice and the remainder of the
corridor was walked once. The well pad was inventoried with he same crew of two
individuals in parallel transects 15 meters apart. Upon completion, the boundary of the
well pad was walked with a GPS unit to produce the map in Figure 1. The crew used a
Trimble GeoXM .

Environment
Theprojectlocation is locatedjustwest of highway24, approximately 4 miles

south of Sigurd, Utah. Ground visibility was good within the well pad and along the
access route. Two steep drainages cut the parcel along its eastern and southern
boundaries. Vegetation is composed sagebrush with various bunch grasses and forbs.
Sediments are a light brown sand and silt.

Results
No cultural resources were located within the well pad or access route. This

includes archaeological sites and isolated



NRDENTIAL

WOLVERINE GAS AND OIL COMPANY OF UTAH, LLC

DRILLING PROGNOSIS

Wolverine Federal #20-1
NW NW SEC 20-T23S-R1W

SEVIER CO, UTAH

BRIEF DRILLING PLAN

Due to surfacetopographyconstraints,directionallydrill a 7050' MD (6650'TVD) test
of the Navajo I formation on a day work contract basis from Wolverine's present work
area known as Drill Pad B-1 located in Sec 17 T238 - R01W, SevierCo, UT. Please refer

to the directionaldrilling plan attached for detailed hole angle,trajectoryand target
information. Deviation is the primary drillingconcern in this area. No abnormal pressure
or hydrogen sulfide gas is expected, however, an H2S detectorwill be utilized. The
projected surface and bottomhole locations are to be as follows:
Surface Location: 833' fsl & 1925' fwl of Sec 17 T23N -- R01W
BHL @top of NVJO1 (6035' TVD) 660' fnl & 660' fwl of Sec 20 T23N - R01W

14" conductor casing will be cemented to surface at approximately 80 ft BGL. 9-5/8"

surface casingwill be set & cemented to surface in a 12-1/4" hole deviatedto
approximately10 deg at +/-1509' (+/-1500'TVD). An 8-3/4" hole will then be drilledto
+/- 7050' (6650' TVD). 5-1/2" production casingwill then be set & cemented to 500'
into the surface casing.

EMERGENCY NUMBERS

Sevier Valley Medical Center (435)-896-8271
Medical Helicopter (800)-453-0120
Sheriff Department (435)-896-2600
Fire Department-Richfield, UT (435)-896-5479
uureauof Land Management (Richfield): (435)-896-1500

Bureau of Land Management (Salt Lake City) (801) 539-4045
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (Salt Lake City): (801)-538-5340

1 Wolverine Federal #20-1 (verl)
Section 19 T23S-R1W

Sevier



Bureau of Land Management;

Contact Al McKee with BLM (801) 539-4045 24 hrs prior to 1) spudding, running and
cementing all casing strings 2) Pressure testingof BOPE or any casing string 3) Pressure
integrity test (mud weight equivalency test) of each casing shoe.
NOTE: Ensure the rig, the cementingand testingprocedures comply with BLM and
Onshore Oil and Gas Order No.2, requirements .

Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

Contact Carol Daniels (801) 538-5284, 24 hrs prior to spudding

GENERAL INFORMATION

OBJECTIVE: Navajo 1 @5935' (TVD) ELEVATION: 5835' GL (est)

PROJECTED TOTAL DEPTH: 7,050 MD; 6650' TVD

SURFACE LOCATION: 833' FSL & 1975' FWL
Section 17-23S-lW

COUNTY: Sevier STATE: Utah

DIRECTIONS TO LOCATION: From town of Sigurd, Utah go south approximately
4.5 miles on Hwy #24 to location on the right side
of road.

PROPOSED CASING PROGRAM:

Hole Size Casing Size Wt.lFt. Grade Joint Measund
Depth Set

14" 80'
12¼" 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 0'-1,510'
8-3/4" 5½" 17# L-80 LTC O'-7,050'

Hole Size Casing Drift OD of Annular Annular Capacity
Size ID, in. Couplings Volume in Volume in of casing,

OH, cf/ft Csg, cf/ft ef/ft
I 14"

12¼" 9-5/8" 8.379 10.625 0.3127 0.4659 0.4340
8-3/4" 5½" 4.767 6.050 0.2526 0.2691 0.1305

2 Wolverine Federal #20-1 (verl)
Section 19 T23S-R1W

Sevier



HDENTIAU

GEOLOGIC INFORMATION:

Formation Interval Interval Lithology Prod Abnormal Psi
(TVD) (MD)

Arapien Surf - 5639' Surf - 5995' Shale, siltstone, salt,
evaporites

TwinCreek1 5639'- 5935' 5995' - 6310' Carbonates
Navajo 1 5935'- 6450' 6310' - 6850' Sandstone w/ minor shale X
Total Depth 6650' 7050' Sandstone w/ minor shale

CONSTRUCTION OF SURFACE LOCATION

325'x 175' Pad
225'x 125' x 10' Reserve Pit with a 12 mil synthetic liner
72" diameter tin horn cellar, 4' to 5' deep.
Flare pit a minimum of 100' fromwellhead.

SURFACE HOLE: 0' to 1510'

Directionally drill a 12-1/4" hole with a TCI rock bit, mud motor & MWD equipment to
approximately 1510' using freshwater and gel/lime sweeps when necessary (make hole to
fit 9-5/8" casing). Loss circulation is not expected to be a problem in this interval. If
losses do occur, begin pumping LCM sweeps. If loss circulation cannot be healed with
+25 ppb LCM, consider dry drilling (no returns). Run survey at every 200' and at TD or
as needed to insure bottom hole location.

PRESSURE CONTROL & SAFETY EOUIPMENT FOR SURFACE

Bottom to Top
14" x 13-5/8" 3M weld on flange
13-5/8" 3M x 13-5/8" 3M spacer spool w/ 3" outlets & valves.
13-5/8" 3M Annular preventer, connected to accumulator with enough capacity to
close annularand retain 200 psi above pre-charge pressure
13-5/8" Drilling Nipple with fill up and circulating line.
Upper kelly cockvalves with handles available

Test Annular to 1500 psi. Test all valves and lines.

3 Wolverine Federal #20-1 (verl)
Section 19 T23S-R1W

Sevier



MUD PROGRAM FOR SURFACE HOLE

DEPTH MUD WEIGHT TYPE VISC PH FLUID LOSS

0 -1510' 8.4 - 8.9 FW/Gel/Lime 26-45 7-9 N/C

Note: Sweep hole every 100 - 200 feet or as needed for hole cleaning. Control the pH
with Lime & Caustic to aid in gel flocculation for bettercarrying capacity.

CASING PROGRAM FOR SURFACE HOLE

DEPTH SIZE LENGTH WT GRADE THREAD REMARKS

0 - 1510' 9 5/8" 1510' 36# J-55 ST&C

Casing Running Sequence:
Texas pattern notched guide shoe,
1 jt of 9 5/8" 36# J-55 ST&C
Float collar
Balance of 9-5/8" 36# J-55 ST&C
10 -- centralizers equally spaced.
RU cement co., hold safety meeting, test lines, cement 9-5/8" casing per cementcompany
recommendation. Displace with fresh water or mud if used. Do not overdisplace
cement.

CEMENTING PROGRAM FOR SURFACE HOLE

Lead:
360 sx 35:65 Poz: Class C or type 5 Mixed at: 12.8 pgg
6% Bentonite Yield: 1.78 ft"/sx
1% Calcium Chloride Water: 9.42 gallsx
0.25 lb/sx CelloFlake

280 sx Class G Mixed at: 15.6
2% Calcium Chloride Yield: 1.20 ft Isx
.25 lb/sx Cello Flake Water: 5.25 gallsx

MUST CIRCULATE CEMENT TO SURFACE per BLM requirements. If the cement
does not circulate to surface contact the BLM office at (435) 896-1500. They will require
either a temperaturesui vey or a cement bond log tobe tun, thendetermine what remedial
action will be taken before drillingout.

4 Wolverine Federal #20-1 (verl)
Section 19 T23S-R1W
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WOC A TOTAL OF 24 HOURS:
Wait 4 hours with the hydrostatic pressure of the displacementfluid in place, then cut off
conductor and weld on an 11" 3M x 9-5/8" SOW casing head. NU BOPE and choke
manifold.

PRESSURE CONTROL AND SAFETY EQUIPMENT FOR
PRODUCTION STRING

Bottom to Top
11" 3M x 9-5/8" esg head.
11" 3M x l1" 3M spacer spool
11" 3M Double Ram Preventer w/ 4-1/2" Pipe ram on top and blind ram on
bottom.Two side outlets, choke side will have two 3" x 3M gate valves. Kill
side will have two 2-1/16 x 3M gate valves and one 2" x 3M check valve.
Connect BOP to choke manifold with pressure guage.
I1" 3M Annular preventer.
11" 3M short rotating head with fill-upline

Upper kelly cock valves with handles available
Safety valves and subs to fit all drillstring connections in use
Inside BOP or float sub available

Testing Procedure:

Annular Preventer

The annular preventer will be pressure tested to 1500 psi for a period of ten minutes or
until provisions of the test are met, whichever is longer. At a minimum, the pressure test
will be performed:

1) When the annular is initially installed
2) Whenever any seal subjectto test pressure is broken
3) Following related repairs and at 30 day intervals

The annular preventer will be functionally operated once per week.

Blowout Preventer

The BOP, choke manifold and related equipment will be pressure tested to 2500 psi, 70%
of the internal yield of the casing. Pressure will be maintained for a period of at least ten
minutes or until the requirements of the test are met, whichever is longer. At a minimum
the pressure test will be perfonned:

1) When the BOP is initially installed
2) Whenever any seal subject to test pressure is broken
3) Following related repairs and at 30 day intervals

5 Wolverine Federal #20-1 (verl)
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GORDER.

The pipe and blind rams will be activated each trip, but not more than once each day. All
BOP drills will be recorded in the IADC driller's log.

Accumulator:

The accumulator will have sufficient capacity to open the hydraulically controlled gate
valve (if so equipped), close all rams plus theannular preventer, and retain a minimum of
200 psig above pre-charge on the closing manifold without the use of the closing unit
pumps. The reservoir capacity will be doublethe accumulator capacity, and the fluid level
will be maintained at the manufacturer's recommendations. The accumulatorshall have 2
independent power sourcesto close the preventers. Nitrogen bottles may be one of the
independent power sources and, if so, shall maintain a charge equal to the manufacturer's
specifications.

The accumulator pre-charge pressure test will be conducted prior to connecting the
closing unit to the BOP stack and at least once every six months thereafter.The
accumulator pressure will be corrected if the measured pre-charge pressure is found to be
above or below the maximum or minimum limits specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order
Number 2 (only nitrogen gas may be used to pre-charge).

Choke Manifold Equipment, Valves and Remote Controls

All choke lines will be straight lines unless tums use tee blocks or are targetedwith
running tees, and will be anchored to prevent whip and vibration

A valve will be mstalled in the closing line as close as possible to the annular preventer to
act as a locking device.This valve will be maintained in the open position and will be
closed only when the power source for the accumulator is inoperative.

Remote controls shall be readily accessible to the driller. Remote controls will be capable
of both opening and closing all preventers. Master controls will be at the accumulatorand
will be capable of opening and closing all preventers and the choke line valve (if so
equipped).

The choke manifold and BOP extension rods with hand wheels will be located outside the
rig sub structure. The hydraulic BOP closingunit will be located at least twenty-fivefeet
from the well head but readily accessibleto the driller.Exact locations and configurations
of the hydraulic BOP closing unit will dependupon the particular rig contracted to drill
this well.

A flare line will be installed after the choke manifold, extending 125 feet from the center
of the drill hole to a separate flare pit.

6 Wolverine Federal #20-1 (verl)
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PRODUCTION HOLE: 1,510' TO 7,050'

Trip in the hole with an 8 3/4" insert bit, mud motor & MWD. Drill float, shoe and 20'of
new hole. Perform an integrity test to 820 psi (10.5 ppg mud wt equivalent). Drill with a
salt saturated mud to the top of the Twin Creek formation.

MUD PROGRAM FOR PRODUCTION HOLE

DEPTH MUD WEIGHT TYPE VISC pH FLUID LOSS

1510' - 5900' 9.8 - 10.3 Saturated Salt 34-45 9.0-10.0 20cc or Less
5900' - 7050' 9.8 - 10.3 Saturated Salt 36-45 9.0-10.0 12cc or Less

Add bulksalt to increaseweight to 9.8 ppg.Maintain the pH at 9.0 to 10.0 using lime and
caustic. Walk viscosity up to 34 cp. Startbringing fluid loss up to 20 cc. If loss circulation
becomesa problem use LCM sweeps to control seepage & clean hole.

EVALUATION PROGRAM FOR PRODUCTION HOLE

At TD, circulateand condition hole clean for logs. Short trip to the last bit trip depth
monitoring well closelyfor flow. TOH for logs.

Mudlogger From surface casing to total depth.

Electric Logs:

Tool Surf csg to TD
Dipole Sonic w/ GR Yes
Dual laterolog and microlog w/ GR & Caliper Yes, GR to surf
LithoDensity/Neutron w/ GR & Caliper Yes
Micro Imaging Dipmeter Yes

DST: To be decided
Cores: To be decided
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CASING PROGRAM FOR PRODUCTION HOLE

DEPTH SIZE LENGTH WT GRADE THREAD REMARKS

O' - TD' 5 ½ 7050' 17.0# L-80 LT&C

Rig up casing tools and run 5 ½" production casing as follows:
Float shoe
2 jointof 5 ½" 17.0# L-80 LT&C casing
Float collar
28 Centralizers, middle shoe jointand one every other joint to 5000'.
Run balance of 5 ½" 17.0# L-80.

CEMENT PROGRAM FOR PRODUCTION CASING

750 sx (50:50) Poz: Premium Weight: 13.0 ppg
3 % Bentonite Yield: 1.76 ff/sx
0.4% Halad R-567 (Low Fluid Loss Control) Water: 8.44 gallsx
15 % Salt
5 lbm/sk Gilsonite
0.3% D-AIR 3000 (Defoamer)
0.25 lb/sx Flocele

350 sx (50:50) Poz: Premium Weight: 13.4 pgg
2 % Bentonite Yield: 1.49 iY/sx
0.2% Halad R-322 (Low Fluid Loss Control) Water: 7.09 gallsx
3 % KCLSalt
3 lbm/sk Silicate Compacted (light Weight Additive)
1 lbm/sk GranuliteTR ¼ (Lost Circulation Additive)
0.2% WG-17(Suspension Agent)
0.25 lb/sx Flocele

TOC at± 1,000 ft
Calculate cement volume basedon log caliper +/- 20%. Displace cement w/water.
Set slips, ND BOP's, cut off NU & test wellhead. Clean pits and release rig.

SCHEDULE

Location preparation is presently scheduled to begin on or about August 15, 2004
Drilling operations are anticipated to begin on or about March 1, 2004

end

8 Wolverine Federal #20-1 (verl)
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BOND STATEMENT

Bond covemge pumuant to 43 CFR 3104 for lease activities is being pmvided by
Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC with their Bond, filed with Buæau of
Land Management in the amount of $25,000.

The Bond Number is WY3329

OPERATOR'S REPRESENTATIVE AND CERTIFICATIONS

The msponsible field æpasentative for the Wolverine Federal #20-1, on behalf of
Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC, is Steve Hash, PE, available via

Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC, One Riverfmnt Plaza, 55 Campau NW,
Grand Rapids, MI 49503. (616) 458-1150.

I hemby certify that I, or persons under my diact supervision, have inspected the drill
site and access mute; that I am familiar with the conditions that cunently exist; that the
statements made in this plan aæ, to the best of my knowledge, tme and conect; and that
the work associated with opemtions pmposed heæin will be perfonned by Wolverine Gas
and Oil Company of Utah, LLC and its contractors and subcontractors in confonnity with
this plan and the tenns and conditions under which it is appmved. This statement is
subject to the pmvisions of 18 U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

Date: July 28 0 4

Name and Title:
Ric Moritz, Vice-Pasident, and



MFluemmi.

BLM Bond No. WY3329

OPERATOR RIDER

This rider is being submitted to comply with 43 CFR 3104.2 which states "
. . . The operator on

the groundshall be covered by a bond in his/her own name as principal, or a bond in the name of

the lessee or sublessee. provided that a consent of the surety, or the obliger in the case of a per-

sonal band. to include the operator under the coverage of the bond is fumished to the Bureau o[-

ßce maintaining the bond."

The obbgpr hereby agrees m extend the coverage of their bond to include liabilities for operations

conducted by WolverineGas and Oil Company of ptan LW and Wolverine Gas and Oi)

Companyof Wyoming, LLC/ on Federal oil and gaa leases. i

Coverageincludes the performance of au lease obitgations, both past and future. includirag the

responsibility to propertyplugand abandon any and all wells. Including related surface restora-

tion, and to pay any outstandtng rentals or royaltica due.

TTus coverage of operations shaR continue whether or not the lease subsequendy expires, termi-

nates. Is canceled. or relinquished; provided. hamlever, that this rider shaR not act to mcrease the

actual cumulative or potentialliabibty of the obligor above the face amount of the bond.

Executed this 3 day of March, 2004.

Witness:
Wolverine andœOttCorporation

One RiverfrontPlaza. 55 Campau NW
Grand Ranids. MI 49503-2616 . ,

Address of witnese For Gary R. Blocker
Vice President and COO

One Riverfront Plaza, 55 Campau NW

Grand Rapids. MI 49503-9616
Obligor's



WOLVERINEGASAND OIL CO'RPORATION
Energy Exploration in Partnership with the Environment

July 26, 2004

United States Department of the Interior
Bureau of Land Management
Richfield Field Office
150 East 900 North
Richfield, Utah 84701

RE: Designated Agent Contact Information: Wolverine Federal #20-1

To Whom It May Concern:

Wolverine Gas and Oil of Utah, LLC (Wolverine) is designating Western Land Services, Inc. as
Agent for the above captioned well. Questions,deficiencies and clarifications regarding this
APD package should be directed to the following contacts with Western Land Services, Inc.:

Shawn Burd
(310 South 100 East, Richfield, UT 84701)
Richfield Office: 435-896-1943
Cellular Phone: 435-979-4689
E-mail: shawn.burd@westernls.com

OR:
Don Anderson
(54 West Seymour, Sheridan, WY 82801)
Office: 307-673-1817
E-mail: don.anderson@westernIs.com

Approvals or other notifications should be directed to me at Wolverine and to the Agent named
above. My contact information is contained within the letterhead address below (extension 119)
and my e-mail address is: rmoritz@wolvgas.com

Sincerely,

Wolve e as and Oil Company of Utah, LLC

Richard D. Moritz
Vice-President, Land & Legal

One Riverfront Plaza • 55 Campau, N.W • Grand Rapids, MI 49503-2616 • 616.458.1150
FAX
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WW
"B"* WOLVERINE FEDERAL #20-1

LEGEND: WOLVERINE GAS & OIL CORP.
PROPOSED LOCATION N WOLVERINE FEDERAL #' 0-1

SECTION 17, T23S, R1W, S.L.3.&M.
SE 1/4 SW 1/4

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I CO 15 0485 South 2OO East Vernal, Utah 84078 M A P MONT DAY YEAR(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813

SCALE:1:100,000 DRAWNBY:K.G REVISED:
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PROPOSED LOCATION:
WOLVERINE FEDERAL #20-

Mud S

LEGEND: WOLVERINE GAS & OIL CORP.
EXISTINGR AD N WOLVERINE FEDERAL#20-1

------------ PROPOSED CENNR AD SECTION 17, T23S, R1W, S.L.B.&M.
SE 1/4 SW



Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC
AzmuUls to TimeNam Pad B-1
MagnaicNarth:12.95° T23S R01W Sevier County,Utah

M Field NWl4 SE/4 Sec 17
: 52136nT

: 64.57° 20-1 SFC Location
Modet: Ëooo SECTION DETAILS 1925' FWL &833' FSL Sec 17 23S OlV

SevierCounty,UT
Sec MD Inc Azi TVD +N/-S +El-W DLeg TFace VSec Target

1 0.0 0.00 220.27 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0
2 300.0 0.00 220.27 300.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 220.27 0.0
3 1508.8 12.00 220.27 1500.0 -96.2 -81.5 0.99 220.27 126.1
4 1878.2 23.08 220.27 1851.7 -181.0 -153.4 3.00 0.00 237.3
5 6040.3 23.08 220.27 5680.5 -1426.0 -1208.2 0.00 0.00 1869.0
6 6309.7 15.00 220.27 5935.0 -14930 -1265.0 3.00 180.00 1956.9 NVJO1 CtrNWl4NW/4 Sec 20
7 7049.9 15.00 220.27 6650.0 -1639.2 -1388.8 0.00 0.00 2148.4

TARGETDETAILS

Name TVD +N/-S +E/-W Shape

NVJO1 Ctr NWl4NW/4 Sec 20 5935.0 -1493.0 -1265.0 Rectangle (400x400)

FORMATION TOP DETA1LS CASING DETAILS

1 No TVDPalh MDPalh Fonnation No TVD MD Name Size

1 5639.0 5995.1 TwmCreck 0 1

2000

ISO

2.ao i en -a ao -se a suo soon
west-yEad(+} ß00B&n]

CkNWI4NWI4 Sec 20

I a I i i i i i I I i i I Pim Pim#I (20 1/20 1)

-1000 1000 2000 3000 CreatedBy stereselmez.PE Date 7/14/2004

Vertical Sedien g 22427" [10002/im] choked



M atherford Directional Sert ,es

Exploration Report

Company: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah Date 7/12/2004 Time: 11:35:29 Page 1
Field: Sovier County, Utah Co-ordinate(NE) Reference Wel: 2 1, True North
Site: Pad B-1 Vertical (TVD) Reference: SITE 0.0
Well: 20-1 Section (VS) Reference: Wel (0.00N,0.00E.220.27Azi)
Welipath: 20-1 Survey Calculation Method: MinimumCurvature Db: Sybase

Site Pad B-1
Section 17 23S TWSevier County Utah
830' FSL & 1901' FWL

SitePosition: Northing: 169376.77 ft Latitude: 38 47 51.068 N
From: Geographic Easting: 1876068.36 ft Longitude: 111 56 5.240 W
Position Uncertainty: 0.0 ft North Reference: True
Ground Level: 0.0 ft Grid Convergence: 4.28 deg

Survey Program for Definitive Welipath
Date 6/14/2004 Validated: No Version: 1
Actual From To Survey Toolcode Tool Name

ft ft

Survey

Stn MD Inci Asim TVD NIS FJW VS DLS Tool Radius
it deg deg it ft it ft deg/100ft ft

0.0 0.00 220.27 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00
100.0 0.00 220.27 100.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 MWD
200.0 0.00 220.27 200.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 MWD
300.0 0.00 220.27 300.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 MWD
400.0 0.99 220.27 400.0 4.7 -0.6 0.9 0.99 MWD

500.0 1.99 220.27 500.0 -2.6 -2.2 3.5 0.99 MWD
600.0 2.98 220.27 599.9 -5.9 -5.0 7.8 0.99 MWD
700.0 3.97 220.27 699.7 -10.6 -9.0 13.9 0.99 MWD
800.0 4.96 220.27 799.4 -16.5 -14.0 21.6 0.99 MWD
900.0 5.96 220.27 898.9 -23.8 -20.1 31.2 0.99 MWD

1000.0 6.95 220.27 998.3 -32.3 -27.4 42.4 0.99 MWD
1100.0 7.94 220.27 1097.4 -42.2 -35.8 55.4 0.99 MWD
1200.0 8.93 220.27 1196.4 -53.4 -45.3 70.0 0.99 MWD
1300.0 9.93 220.27 1295.0 -65.9 -55.9 86.4 0.99 MWD
1400.0 10.92 220.27 1393.4 -79.7 47.6 104.5 0.99 MWD

1508.8 12.00 220.27 1500.0 -96.2 -81.5 126.1 0.99 9 5/8"
1600.0 14.74 220.27 1588.7 -112.3 -95.2 147.2 3.00 MWD
1700.0 17.74 220.27 1684.7 -133.6 -113.2 175.2 3.00 MWD
1800.0 20.74 220.27 1779.1 -158.8 -134.5 208.1 3.00 MWD
1878.2 23.08 220.27 1851.7 -181.0 -153.4 237.3 3.00 MWD

1900.0 23.08 220.27 1871.7 -187.6 -158.9 245.8 0.00 MWD
2000.0 23.08 220.27 1963.7 -217.5 -184.2 285.0 0.00 MWD
2100.0 23.08 220.27 2055.7 -247.4 -209.6 324.2 0.00 MWD
2200.0 23.08 220.27 2147.7 -277.3 -234.9 363.4 0.00 MWD
2300.0 23.08 220.27 2239.7 -307.2 -260.3 402.6 0.00 MWD

2400.0 23.08 220.27 2331.7 -337.1 -285.6 441.9 0.00 MWD
2500.0 23.08 220.27 2423.7 -367.0 -311.0 481.1 0.00 MWD
2600.0 23.08 220.27 2515.7 -396.9 -336.3 520.3 0.00 MWD
2700.0 23.08 220.27 2607.7 -426.9 -361.7 559.5 0.00 MWD
2800.0 23.08 220.27 2699.7 -456.8 -387.0 598.7 0.00 MWD

2900.0 23.08 220.27 2791.7 -486.7 -412.3 637.9 0.00 MWD
3000.0 23.08 220.27 2883.7 -516.6 -437.7 677.1 0.00 MWD
3100.0 23.08 220.27 2975.6 -546.5 -463.0 716.3 0.00 MWD
3200.0 23.08 220.27 3067.6 -576.4 488.4 755.5 0.00 MWD
3300.0 23.06 220.27 3159.6 -606.3 -513.7 794.7 0.00 MWD

3400.0 23.08 220.27 3251.6 -636.2 -539.1 833.9 0.00 MWD
3500.0 23.08 220.27 3343.6 -666.1 -564.4 873.1 0.00 MWD
3600.0 23.08 220.27 3435.6 -696.1 -589.8 912.3 0.00 MWD
3700.0 23.08 220.27 3527.6 -726.0 -615.1 951.5 0.00 MWD
3800.0 23.08 220.27 3619.6 -755.9 440.4 990.7 0.00 MWD

3900.0 23.08 220.27 3711.6 -785.8 -665.8 1029.9 0.00



\ aatherford Directional Ser ces
Exploration Report

Company: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah Date: 7/12/2004 Time: 11:35:29 Page 2
Field: Sovier County, Utah Co-ordinate(NE) Reference: Well:20-1, True North -

Site Pad B-1 Vertical (TVD) Reference SITE 0.0
Well: 20-1 Section (VS) Reference: WeH(0.00N,0.00E,220.27Azi)
Well path: 20-1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature Db: Sybase

Survey

Stn MD Inci Azim TVD N/S E/W VS DLS Tool Radius
ft deg deg ft ft 11 ft deg/100ft ft

4000.0 23 08 220.27 3803.6 -815.7 di91.1 1069.1 0.00 MWD
4100.0 23.08 220.27 3895.6 -845.6 -716.5 1108.3 0.00 MWD
4200.0 23.08 220.27 3987.6 -875.5 -741.8 1147.5 0.00 MWD
4300.0 23.08 220.27 4079.6 -905.4 -767.2 1186.7 0.00 MWD

4400.0 23.08 220.27 4171.6 -935.4 -792.5 1226.0 0.00 MWD
4500.0 23.08 220.27 4263.6 -965.3 -817.9 1265.2 0.00 MWD
4600.0 23.08 220.27 4355.6 -995.2 -843.2 1304.4 0.00 MWD
4700.0 23.08 220.27 4447.6 -1025.1 -868.5 1343.6 0.00 MWD
4800.0 23.08 220.27 4539.5 -1055.0 -893.9 1382.8 0.00 MWD

4900.0 23.08 220.27 4631.5 -1084.9 419.2 1422.0 0.00 MWD
5000.0 23.08 220.27 4723.5 -1114.8 -944.6 1461.2 0.00 MWD
5100.0 23.08 220.27 4815.5 -1144.7 -969.9 1500.4 0.00 MWD
5200.0 23.08 220.27 4907.5 -1174.7 -995.3 1539.6 0.00 MWD
5300.0 23.08 220.27 4999.5 -1204.6 -1020.6 1578.8 0.00 MWD

5400.0 23.08 220.27 5091.5 -1234.5 -1046.0 1618.0 0.00 MWD
5500.0 23.08 220.27 5183.5 -1264.4 -1071.3 1657.2 0.00 MWD
5600.0 23.08 220.27 5275.5 -1294.3 -1096.6 1696.4 0.00 MWD
5700.0 23.08 220.27 5367.5 -1324.2 -1122.0 1735.6 0.00 MWD
5800.0 23.08 220.27 5459.5 -1354.1 -1147.3 1774.8 0.00 MWD

5900.0 23.08 220.27 5551.5 -1384.0 -1172.7 1814.0 0.00 MWD
5995.1 23.08 220.27 5639.0 -1412.5 -1196.8 1851.3 0.00 Twin Cre
6000.0 23.08 220.27 5643.5 -1413.9 -1198.0 1853.2 0.00 MWD
6040.3 23.08 220.27 5680.5 -1426.0 -1208.2 1869.0 0.00 MWD
6100.0 21.29 220.27 5735.8 -1443.2 -1222.8 1891.6 3.00 MWD

6200.0 18.29 220.27 5829.9 -1469.0 -1244.7 1925.4 3.00 MWD
6309.7 15.00 220.27 5935.0 -1493.0 -1265.0 1956.9 3.00 NVJOi Ct
6400.0 15.00 220.27 6022.2 -1510.8 -1280.1 1980.2 0.00 MWD
6500.0 15.00 220.27 6118.8 -1530.6 -1296.8 2006.1 0.00 MWD
6600.0 15.00 220.27 6215.4 -1550.3 -1313.6 2032.0 0.00 MWD

6700.0 15.00 220.27 6312.0 -1570.1 -1330.3 2057.9 0.00 MWD
6800.0 15.00 220.27 6408.6 -1589.8 -1347.0 2083.8 0.00 MWD
6900.0 15.00 220.27 6505.2 -1609.6 -1363.8 2109.6 0.00 MWD
7000.0 15.00 220.27 6601.8 -1629.3 -1380.5 2135.5 0.00 MWD
7049.9 15.00 220.27 6650.0 -1639.2 -1388.8 2148.4 0.00 5 1/2"

Casing Points

MD TVD Diameter Hole Size Name
ft ft in in

1508 8 1500.0 9.625 12.250 9 5/6"
7049.9 6650.0 5.500 6.000 5 1/2"

Formations

MD TVD Formations Lithology Dip Angle Dip Direction
ft ft deg deg

5995.1 5639.0 Twin Creek 0.00
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WOLVERINEGAS & OIL e JRP.
TYPICAL RIG LAYOUT FOR

WOLVERINEFEDERAL #20-1
SECTION 17, T23S, R1W, S.L.B.&M.

833' FSL 1925' FWL
SCALE: 1" = 60'
DATE: 6-17-04

Drawn By C.G.
DATE: 7-7-04

90'

Flare N b
Pit '¯ ©

/ 85' 40'
125'

PIPE RACKS

I I I I
#19-1

DOG HOUSE

¯¯ 50 2o-1 125 -

-
-

PUMP
-

-- -------¯ TOILET
MUD SHED

----

HOPPER

Total P/t Capacity
POWER

W/J' of Freeboard
= JO,260 Bb/s. ±

-

Total Pit Volume
TOOLS STORAGE

- 7,940 Cu. Yds. TRASH TANK

FUEL

UINTAH ENCINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
85 So. 200 Kast * Yernal, Utah 84078 * (435)



WOLVERINEGAS & OIL COL . FIGURE #2
S EXISTINGCROSS SECTIONS FOR

X-Section
" soole WOLVERINEFEDERAL#20-1

2"
1" =

100, SECTION 17, T23S, R1W, S.L.B.&M.

833' FSL 1925' FWL
DATE: 3-10-04
Drawn By: C.G
DATE: 4-12-0
DATE: 4-16-04

60

10' 125' 50' 125 S e- / //2 1

ocArio srA

SM. 2+10

10° 125' 125

cur ISI OlŠl I 1511 |
SM. 0+60

Pr astmet/on
145'

NOTE:
Topson should not be
Stripped Below Finished SM. 0+00
Crade on Substructure Area.

* HO7E:
RU. QU4HR7Y INCŒDES

APPROXIMATEYARDAGES sx rav couvacriov

CUT EXCESS MATERIAL = 23,160 Cu. Yds.

(6") Topsoil Strlpping = 2,240 Cu. Yds. Topsoil & Pit Bockfill = 6, JOO Cu. Yds.

Remaining Location = 25,900 Cu. Yds. (1/2 Pit Vol.)

EXCESS UNBALANCE = 16,860 Cu. Yds.

TOTAL CUT = 28,140 CU.YDS. (After Rehabilitation)

FILL = 4,980 CU.YDS. UINTAN ENG1NEERING & LAND SURVEYING
86 So. Æ00 East * Termal, TRah 84078 * (486)
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WORKSHEET

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 08/05/2004 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-041-30032

WELL NAME: WOLVERINE FED 20-1

OPERATOR: WOLVERINE GAS & OIL CO ( N1655 )

CONTACT: RICHARD MORITZ PHONE NUMBER: 616-458-1150

PROPOSED LOCATION:

SESW 17 230S 010W INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
SURFACE· 0814 FSL 1933 FWL .

Tech Review Initials Date
BOTTOM: 0660 FNL 0660 FWL

SEVIER Engineering

COVENANT ( 492 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal Surface
LEASE NUMBER: UTU-73528

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal
LATITUDE: 38.79746

PROPOSED FORMATION: NAVA

COALBED METHANE WELL? NO LONGITUDE: -111.9339

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

Plat R649-2-3.

Bond:Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[]
Unit WOLVERINE

(No. WY 3329 )
Potash (Y/N) R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920'Between Wells

Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception
(No.63-2529 )

RDCC Review (Y/N)
Drilling Unit

(Date: ) Board Cause No:
Eff Date:

I Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

| 1A Intent to Commingle (Y/N) .R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS: L')66ë (M /\ LM ( )
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OPERATOR: WOLVERINE G&O CO (N1655)

SEC: 17 T. 23S R. 1W

FIELD: COVENANT (492)

COUNTY: SEVIER

SPACING: R649-3-11 / DIRECTIONAL DRILLING I JECTION
GAS STORAGE

X LOCATION ABANDONED
e NEW LOCATION NField Status Unit Status * PLUGGED & ABANDONED

ABANDONED EXPLORATORY PRODUCING GAS
ACTIVE GN PST LRAGE e PRHODUCIGNAGSOIL
COMBINED NF SECONDARY

. SHUT-IN OIL W E
INACTIVE PENDING

p( TEMP. ABANDONED
PROPOSED OGALS

TEST WELL
ROMNGAETED

PP GEOTill RMI. A WATER INJECTION S
PP OIL WATER SUPPLY PREPARED BY: DIANA WHITNEY
SECONDARi WATER DISPOSAL DATE: 10-AUG-2005
TERMlNATTO .



WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 08/05/2004 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-041-30032

WELL NAME: WOLVERINE FED 20-1

OPERATOR: WOLVERINE GAS & OIL CO ( N1655 )

CONTACT: RICHARD MORITZ PHONE NUMBER: 616-458-1150

PROPOSED LOCATION:

SESW 17 230S 010W INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /

SURFACE: 0833 FSL 1925 FWL Tech Review Initials Date

Al BOTTOM: 0660 FNL 0660 FWL , , &O
SEVIER

Engineering

WILDCAT ( 1 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal Surface

LEASE NUMBER: UTU-73528

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal LATITUDE: 38.79729
PROPOSED FORMATION: NAVA

COALBED METHANE WELL? NO
LONGITUDE: 111.93382

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

v/' Plat R649-2-3.

s?' Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[] Unit WOLVERINE
(No. WY 3329 )

FA Potash (Y/N)
R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

y/' Water Permit
R649-3-3. Exception

(No.63-2529 )
Drilling Unit

PA RDCC Review (Y/N) Board Cause No:
(Date: ) Eff Date:

jüP Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

y/ R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:

STIPULATIONS:



T23S R2W T23S R1W

1ž
1 I

Jill i I
WOIVEkiNLFEO17-1 I*

WOLVEREINE UNIT UntWL'ia
WOL4tRINEFU)\7.5

mni )þ WOLVERINE FED 2Ibl
i e WOLVEKINE FED19-1

WOLVERINE FED 1&1
WOLVERINEEED37.2

BHL191 BHL21 1

OPERATOR: WOLVERINE GacO CO (N1655)

SEC. 17 T.23S R.1W

FIELD: WILDCAT (001)

COUNTY: SEVIER

SPACING: R669-3-11 / DIRECTIONAL DRILLING

elis UriitsahP Fields.shp
IJtah OilGas anol Mining

GASINjECTION EXPLORATORY ABANDONED

GAS STORAGE GAS STORAGE ACriVE
LOCATION ABANDONED
NEW LOCATION

NF PP OIL COMBINED

PLUGGED & ABANDONED NF SECONDARY INACTIVE

PRODUCENG GAS PENDING PROPOSED
PRODUCING OIL Pi OIL STORAGE
SHUT-IN CAS PP GAS TERMINATED

• SHUT-IN OIL PP GEDTHERML 5
si TEMP. ABANDONED

TEST WELL PP OIL

s WATER INJECTION SECONDARY

• WATER SUPPLY TERMINATED PREPARED BY:DIANA WHITNEY

e WATER DISPOSAL
DATE-



WOLVERINE GAS AND OIL COMPANY
of Utah, LLC

Energy Exploration in Partnership with the Environment

August 3, 2005

Mr. Al McKee
Bureau of Land Management
Utah State Office
440 West 200 South, Suite 500
Salt Lake City, Utah 84101

RE: Wolverine Federal #20-1
API # 43-041-30032
Sevier County, UT

Dear Mr. McKee:

The enclosed sundry covers the Wolverine Federal #20-1, located in Sevier County, and the
following changes: 1) Change in surface location because of different slot designation on the drilling
pad (see revised well plat); and 2) Change in casing program so it reflects the current casing
program (e.g., 7" production casing instead of 5-1/2"), and which is consistent to previously
approved wells. Changes are made to the cement program to fit the new casing program. The
changes are summarized on the table included with the sundry.

If you have any questions, please call.

Edward A. Higuera
Manager-Development

Enclosures

c: Diana Whitney, UDOGM w/attachments
Steve Hash w/attachments

One Riverfront Plaza • 55 Campau, N.W • Grand Rapids, MI 49503-2616 • 616.458.1150
FAX



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU-73528

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IFINDIAN.ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to Wolverine Fed E loration Unit
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

Xp

1. TYPE OF WELL
8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER Wolverine Federal #20-1

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR:
9. API NUMBER:

Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC * 4304130032

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

55 campauNW CITY
Grand Raids sy,,, Mi z,749503 (616) 458-1150 Covenant Field

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 833' FSL & 1,925' FWL COUNTY: Sevier

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SESW 17 23S TW STATE:
UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL

(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPROOUC1NGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Wolverine proposes the changes listed on the attached table to be consistent with current casing program used for the field,

and to reflect changes in the surface location because of revisions to slot designation.

Revised drilling&direction plan is attached.

See attached summary table; revised plat; revised BOP schematic.

Utah Division of
L 790 0 Oil, Gas and Mining

4 450 K ( I. 49 '7 Date: - C>-D
By:

NAME (PLE E PRINT)
Edwa . Higue TITLE Manager Development

SIGNATURE
// 005

(This space for State use only) RECE IVED
AUSO8 2005

(5/2000)
(SeelnstructionsonReverseSide)

DIVOFOIL,GAS&



Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(September 2001) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
ExOp

es u
230504

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-73528
Do not use this form for proposals to dri/I or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Otherínstructions on reverse side 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well
Wolverine Fed Exploration Unit

Oil Well Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Wolverine Federal #20-1

Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC 9. APlWellNo.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-041-30032-00-00

55 Cam pau NW, Grand Rapids, MI 49503 (616) 458-1150 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Foorage, Sec., T.,R., M., or Survey Description) Exploratory

Surface: 833' FSL & 1,925' FWL, SE/SW, Sec 17, T23S, R1W 11. County or Parish, State

Bottom: 660' FNL & 660 FWL, NW/NW, Sec 20, T23S, R1W Sevier County, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Notice of Intent Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation WeH Integrity

O Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon

O Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.

If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once

testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Wolverine proposes the changes listed on the attached table to be consistent with current casing programs used in the field,
and to reflect changes in the surface location because of revisions to slot designation.

See attached summary table; revised plat; revised BOP schematic

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Edward A. Higuera Title Manager - Development

Signature August 4, 2005

THis SP FED RAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certifhyw dthe pl nappicantk onrequ blentitle to those rights in the subject lease Office RECE1VED
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department gen gf ed
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter w1u11nits jurisdiction. y Ö

(Instructions on reverse)
DN.0F0\L,GAS&



Wolverine Gas & Oil Company of Utah, LLC,
Proposed Changes for Wolverine Federal 20-1

Item FROM (original Permitted) TO: (change) Comment
Surface Location 833 FSL & 1925 FWL, SE/SW Section 17, 814 FSL & 1933 FWL, SE/SW Section 17, T23S-RlW Change in slot

T23S-R1W designation on pad
Hole Size 12-l/4"/8-3/4" 17-1/2"/12-1/4"/8-l/2" Hole size changed to fit

new casmg program
Casing program 14" conductor to 80' 20" conductor to 120'

9-5/8", 36 ppf J-55 at 1510' 13-3/8", 61# J-55 at 2400' +/-

5-1/2", 17 ppf L-80 at 7250' 9-5/8", 47# N-80 (or HCP-110)at 6300' +/-

7", 26# N-80 (or HCP-Il0) at 7171' +/-

Cement program 9-5/8"Csg: Lead 360 sx, 1.76 yld, 12.8 ppg; 13-3/8" Csg:: Lead 800 sx hi-fill, 3.86 yld, 11 ppg; Tail: 470 sx Cement change to fit
Tail: 280 sx, 1.20 yld, 13.4 ppg Prem G, 1.18 yld, 15.8 ppg· casing program
5-1/2" Csg: 750 sx, 1.76 yld, 13 ppg; 9-5/8" Csg: 350 sx 50:50 Poz, 1.71 yld, 13 ppg
Tail: 350 sx, 1.49 yld, 13.4 ppg 7" Csg: 500 sx 50:50 Poz, 1.27 yld, 14.35 ppg

BOP/Surface 14" x 13-5/8" 3M weld on flange 20" casing with one 7-1/16" flanged outlet with 7-1/16" HCR Change to fit new
13-5/8" 3M x 13-5/8 3M spacer spool with 3" valve and 6" casing program
outlets; blooie line to flare pit
13-5/8" annular preventer, connected to 20" drilling nipple with fillup line and 10-3/4" flow line w/
accumulator flowline valve
13-5/8 drilling nipple with fillup line and 20" rotating head
circulating line

BOP/productive esg 11" 3M x 9-5/8" esg head 13-5/8" SM x 13-3/8" SOW casing head w/ (2) 2-1/16" SSO's Change to fit new
11" 3M x 11" 3M spacer spool (for 9-5/8") casmg program
11" 3M double rampreventer w/4-1/2" pipe 13-5/8" 5M x 13-5/8" 5M multi-bowl casing spool (for 7")
ram on top and blind ram on bottom; two side 13-5/8" 5M x 13-5/8" spacer spool
outlets, choke side will have 3"x 3M gate 13-5/8" 5M x 13-5/8" 5M mud cross with (2) side outlets:
valves. Kill side will have two 2-1/16" x 3M one outlet 2-1/16" 5M kill line
gate valves, one 2" x 3M check valve. one outlet 3-1/16" 5M choke line
11" 3M annular preventer 13-5/8" 5M double ram BOP w/ 5" pipe rams top & CSO rams
11" 3M short rotating head w/fill up line btm

13-5/8" 5M Annular Preventer
13-5/8" 5M rotating head
Connect BOP to choke manifold with pressure guage
Upper kelly cock valves with handles available
Safety valves and subs to fit all drill string connections in use
Inside BOP or float sub



Section 17, T.23 S., R.1 W., S.L.B. & M. PROJECT
Wolverine Gas & 011Componv of Utah. LLC.

WELLLOCATION,LOCATEDAS SHOWNlN THE SE 1/4 OF THE
SW 1/4 OF SECTION 17. T.23 S., R.1 W., S.L.B. & M.

SEVIER COUNTY,UTAH

FOUN 2

$890020 2F4 3

7 B.LM.
LEGEND

COUNTYALUMINUMCAP BRASSCAP # = SECT10N CORNERS LOCATED
- QUARTERSECTION CORNERSLOCATED
= PROPOSED WELLHEAD

NOTE: THE PURPOSE OF THIS SURVEY WAS TO PLAT
THE WOL\ÆRINEFEDERAL#20-1 LOCATION.
LOCATEDIN THE SE 1/4 OF THE SW 1/4
OF SECTION17. T.23 S.. R.1 W., S.L.B. & M.

-.---- -. -.... --. -..... -
SEVIER COUNTY.

BASIS OF ELEVATlON
ELEVATIONBASED ON U.S.G.S.BENCH MARKLOCATEDIN
THE SW 1/4 OF SECTION 17, T.23 S., R.1 W., S.LB. & M.

FOUND1967 B.LM. I FOUND1967 B.LM. o
BRASSCAP BRASS IIIIM MIIIIII

----. ---. -y- --- -- Milll- -IIII
SCALE

CERTIFICATE
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THIS PLAT WAS PREPARED FROM
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUALSURVEYSMADEBY ME OR UNDER
MY SUPERVISION,AND THAT TH MEARE TRUE AND
CORRECTTO THE BEST AND BELIEF.

oo
933. I WOLVERINEFEDERAL#20-1 4 TREVO AD . . #343639 DATE

ELEV.GRADEDGROUND= 5839.00

REESTABUSHEDFROMI FOUND1987 B.LM. OE Of
FOUND1987 B.Lg A 1967 B.LM. SURVEYI BRASS CAP si.....,,.....au

enAss cAP e i Jones & DeMille Engineering
1535 Sout 1P

on )
69R h6fl26dUtah 64701

SS7'30'57 W - 2456.54 Fox
(435)5 ese-s2ee

www.jonesanddamRie.com

BASIS OF BEARINGS Well Locotlon Plot for
BASIS OF BEARINGUSED WAS NO2'13'08"W BETWEENTHE SOUTHWESTCORNER
AND THE WEST QUARTERCORNER OF SECTION 17. T.23 S., R.1 W., S.L.B. & M Wolverine Gas & Oil Company of Utah, LLC.

LATITUDE-
38°4750,9446" (38.797484611) DESSNED SURWTED CHEŒED DRMN PAAECTNO. SHEETNO.

LONGITUDE= -11156'04.9969" (111.934721361) T.WG. T.R.G. KB.B.
om osume su 0505-053 1

38/03/05 B-Wells 1" =



PRESSURE CONTROL SYSTEM SCHEMATIC
operator:
Wolverine Gas & Oil Co. of Utah, LLC

Prepared by:
EXACT Engineering, Inc

Tulsa, OK (918) 599-9400 Well name and number

SM BOP Stack --- to be utilized while drillingholes fcr
Wolverine Federal #20-1

protective and production casings thru lower Arapien, Twin Creek
& Navajo intervals

Max. anticipated surface pressure 3000 psi
ca. g B.O.P.

Manual
Hydraulic

Annular B.O.P. 13-5/8"-5M W ___

Sour Trim

B.O.P. 5" pipe Rams 13-5/8" - 5M WP
(Pipe/Blind)

o / B.O.P. blind Rams 13-5/8" -- 5M W.P.
(Pipe/Blind)

Check Valve 2-1/16" 5M WP
Valve 3-1/16" 5M WP

Valve 2-1/16" 5M WP noon

Valve 2-1/16 SM WP
Valve 3-1/16" 5M WP

Kill Line Manifold Line 3-1/16" 5M WP

Spool 13-5/8" 5M x 13-5/8" 5M x 2-1/16" x 3-1/16" SM outlet -

Wellhead 13-5/8" 5M x 13-5/8" 5M multibowl
wl 13-5/8" 5M x 13-3/8" 5M SOW csg



WESTERNLANDSERVICES

August 18, 2004

Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
1594 W. N. Temple Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

RE: Wolverine Gas & Oil Company of Utah, LLC requests permission to drill the
Wolverine Federal #20-1

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to Rule R649-3-11 of the State's Oil & Gas Conservation regulations,
Wolverine Gas & Oil Company of Utah, LLC, hereby makes application for approval to
directionally drill an oil & gas well.

Wolverine Gas & Oil Company of Utah, LLC (Wolverine) proposes to drill the
Wolverine Federal #20-1 well to a total depth of 7,050 feet and is an exception to Rule
R649-3-3. Wolverine is the only leasehold operator within a 460 foot radius of the bore
hole.

The mountainous terrain of the area is such that directional drilling is the most effective
method to minimize surface disturbance. By locating the well pad on a relatively flat
surface and drilling a directional well beneath this challenging topography, Wolverine
can most effectively minimize surface disturbance and ensure proper utilization of
resources.

Attached hereto is a plat as required by the Commissions rules and regulations.

If no objections are filed, the applicant requests that this application be approved. If
objections are filed, applicant requests the matter be set for hearing and that it be advised
of the hearing date.

Respectfully subm°tte
,

Wolverine G Oi ompan , LLC

nB
Authorized Agent

WESTERN LAND SERVICEs - UTAH
310 South 100 East • Richfield, UT 84701 • Phone: (435) 896-1943 • Fax: (435) 893-2134

Web:



United StaLOS Department of the Interior Mf
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

RICHFIELD FIELD OFFICE TAKE PRIDE"
%cu a 150 East 900 North mAMERicA

Richfield, Utah 84701

In Reply Refer To:

3160
(UT-050)

August 10, 2004

Mr. Richard D. Moritz
Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC
One Riverfront Plaza
55 Campau NW
Grand Rapids, Michigan 49503

Dear Mr. Moritz:

On July 22, 2004, four Applications for Permit to Drill and on July 28, 2004, three additional

Applications for Permit to Drill were filed in this office. These seven wells are Wolveine #17-3,

17-4, 17-5, 16-1, 18-1, 19-1, and 20-1 and are on Federal lease UTU-73528. The well pad

locations for these wells are in Section 17, T. 23 S., R. 1 W., SLM, Sevier County, Utah. Your

applications have been reviewed for completeness in accordance with the provisions of the

Federal regulations and the Onshore Oil and Gas Orders.

Based on Onshore Order 1, with the reference to the appropriate section, the following items are

missing or need clarification in your applications:

Section III.G. 3, Form 3160-3 or as an attachment:
c. Type of drilling tools (rotary or cable).
d. Casing condition (new or used).

Section III.G. 4. a., Drilling Plan:
(2) The anticipated contents of each geologic structure or stratum (water, oil, gas

or other minerals).
(3) Pressure control schematic.
(4) As these are exploratory wells, the design factors for each casing string. (See

Onshore Order #2, Drilling Operations, III. B. Casing and Cementing

Requirements.)

Section III.G. 4. b., Surface Use Program:
(3) Location of existing wells. For 17-3, 17-4, 17-5, and 16-1, the Location Map

does not show the existing Well 17-2. For 18-1, 19-1, and 20-1, the Location

Map does not show the existing well 17-1. Are any water wells within the

one-mile parameter of the Order? At the proposed well site for 17-3, 17-4,

17-5, and 16-1, three well pads are shown. Two of the pads are assumed to



the existing well pad (17-1) and the proposed pad (17-3 and others); however,
the third pad is not identified.

(4) Location of proposed production facilities.
(5) Location of water supply. Be specific as to the source, if it is non-Federal.

(9) Well site layout. Living facilities and the orientation of the rig and other
facilities are not included on a layout.

(11) Surface Ownership. The surface ownership of the well and access road shall
be indicated. Where the surface of the well is privately owned, the operator
shall include the name, address, and phone number, if known, of the surface
owner. If privately owned, the existence of an agreement between the
operator and owner needs to be provided.

All the above items will be necessary before approval can be granted. All other portions of your
application are in place, and we will continue to process your application up to the point the
missing information prevents further action.

If future applications are filed, we request that Wolverine Gas and Oil adhere closely to Onshore
Order No. 1, Section III. G. Components of a Complete Application for Permit to Drill. In the
order, the Drilling Plan and the Surface Plan items are enumerated for ease of reference during
both the preparation and the review of a proposal. All these items are required by regulation, and
following the outline in the Order will facilitate the review of your applications. Although some
items appear unnecessary or outdated, please provide the information. Unless specifically
requested, additional information is unnecessary and may lengthen the review time frames.

In addition, the Application for Permit to Drill package does not need to be filed in a binder for
the BLM. BLM records are kept in a file folder, so we remove the binder for ease of filing for
our record keeping.

If you have any questions, please contact Michael Jackson at (435) 896-1522. Technical
questions on the Drilling Plan may be directed to Al McKee at (801) 539-4045.

Sincerely,

Gary L. Kall
Assistant Field Manager

cc: Western Land Services, 54 West Seymour Street, Sheridan, Wyoming
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United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LANDMANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O.Box45155

SaltLakeCity,Utah84145-0155

INREPLYREFERTO:
3160
(UT-922)

August 16,2004

Meniorandurn

To: Field Office Manger, Richfield Field Office

From: Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer

Subject: 2004 Plan of Development Wolverine Unit Sevier County,
Utah.

Pursuant to email between Diana Whitney, Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, and Mickey
Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land Management, the following wells are
planned for calendar year 2004 within the Wolverine Unit, Sevier County, Utah.

API# WELLNAME LOCATION

(Proposed PZ Navajo)

43-041-30032 Wolverine Federal 20-1 sec 17 T23S RO1W 0833 FSL 1925 FWL

BHL Sec 20 T23S RO1W 0660 FNL 0660 FWL

43-041-30033 Wolverine Federal 19-1 sec 17 T23S RO1W 0857 FSL 1919 FWL

BHL Sec 19 T23S RO1W 0660 FNL 0660 FEL

43-041-30034 Wolverine Federal 18-1 Sec 17 T23S RO1W 0845 FSL 1922 FWL

BHL Sec 18 T23S RO1W 0660 FSL 0660 FEL

43-041-30035 Wolverine Federal 17-4 Sec 17 T23S RO1W 1736 FNL 2298 FWL

BHL Sec 17 T23S RO1W 1980 FSL 1980 FEL

43-041-30036 Wolverine Federal 17-3 Sec 17 T23S RO1W 1736 FNL 2283 FWL

BHL Sec 17 T23S R01W 1980 FSL 0660 FWL

43-041-30037 Wolverine State 16-1 Sec 17 T23S RO1W 1736 FNL 2253 FWL

BHL Sec 16 T23S RO1W 0660 FNL 0660 FWL

43-041-30038 Wolverine Federal 17-5 Sec 17 T23S R01W 1736 FNL 2268 FWL

BHL Sec 17 T23S ROlW 1980 FNL 0660 FEL



OLENE S. WALKER
Governor

GAYLE F. McKEACHNIE
Lieutenant Govemor

State of Utah August 19, 2004

Department of
Natural Resources

ROBERT L MORGAN
Executive Director Wolverine Gas & Oil Company of Utah, LLC

One Riverfront Plaza
Division of Grand Rapids, MI 49503

Oil, Gas & Mining

LOWELL R BRAXTON
vivisionDirec'°r Re: Wolverine Federal 20-1 Well, Surface Location 833' FSL, 1925' FWL, SE SW,

Sec. 17, T. 23 South, R. 1 West, Bottom Location 660' FNL, 660' FWL,
NW NW, Sec. 20, T. 23 South, R. 1 West, Sevier County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-041-30032.

A John R. Baza
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Sevier County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Moab District Office

f
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

telephone (801) 538-5340• facsimile (801) 359-3940 •TTY (801) 538-7458 • www.ogm.utah.gov Where ideas



Operator: Wolverine Gas & Oil Company of Utah, LLC

Well Name & Number Wolverine Federal 20-1

API Number: 43-041-30032
Lease: UTU-73528

Surface Location: SE SW Sec.1 T. 23 South R. 1 West
Bottom Location: NW NW Sec. 20 T. 23 South R. 1 West

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling,.

5. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Board").
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.

6. In accordance with Utah Admin. R.649-3-l l, Directional Drilling, the operator shall submit a
complete angular deviation and directional survey report to the Division within 30 days
following completion of the



FROM IldOLVERINE To a 801 359 3940 2005,01-28 OSI45AM #381 P.02/02

0 08
WOLVERINEGAS AND OlL COMPANY

ofUtah, LLC
Entity AxplorationinPartnershipwith the Env/mnment

January 28, 2005

Stateof Utah Via Fax (801) 359-3940
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
1594West North Templc
Suite 1210

- Salt LakeCity, UT 84114-5801

Ro: ApprovedAPDs
Wolverine Federal 18-l, 19-1& 20-1

To Whom11May Concern:

Wolverine Gas and Oil Corporation of Utah, as operator of the captioned
wells (API Nos. 43-041-30032, 43-041-30033 and 43-041-30034), hereby
requestscopies of the approved Applications to Drill with any c<mditionsfor
approval for said wells. Please fax themto my attentionat (616) 458-0869.

lf you have anyquestions or concerns, please feel free to contact me.

- SuoA. Henson

RECEIVED
JAN28 2005

DIV.0FOlt,GAS&MINING

One RiverfmmPlaza • 53 Camjxtu,NW' • Grand Ruµids,M149303-2616 • 6/6,4581150
FAX6I



FROM aldoLVERINE TO : 801 359 3940 2øøs,01-28 09:45AM #381 P.01/02

\WOLVERINE /
WOLVERINEGAS AND OIL CORPORATION

One RiverfrontPla2a, 55 Campau NW Telephone: 016.458.1150
ww....AO MOLc..omy fand BapÎdB, Mlchigarl49503-2616 Fax: 616.458,0869

RECIPIENT: ÒV\

DATE:

FROM: TIME:

MATERIALSSENT: FAXNO.:

NUMBEROF PAGES(including this cover sheet):

IFTRANSMISSION IS INCOMPLETE,PLEASE CALL AT $18.458.1150,

COMMENTS,IF ANY:

CONFIDENTIALflYNOTICE

1NISFACSIMILETRANSMISSIONANDANYAccCMPANYlNGDOCUMENTSCONTAININroflMATIONBELONGINGTO THE
SENDERWHICHMAYBECONFIDENTIAI.ANDLEGALLYPRMLEGED.THISINFORMATIONISINTENDEDONLYFORTHEUSE
OF THE RECiPIENT70 WHOMTHIS FACSIMILETAANSMISSIONWASSENTAS INDICATEDABOVE,IFYOUARENOT THE
INTENDED REDIPIENT, ANYOl$CLOSURE, COPYING,DJSTRlDUTION,ORACYlONTAKENINRELIANCEONTHECONTENTSOF
THEINFOt1MATIONCONTAINEDINTHISFACSIMILETRANSMlSSIONIS STRICTLYPROHlBlTED.IFYOUHAVEREGElVED1HIS
INFORMATIONJNEARON,PLEASENOTIFY US IMMEDIATELYSY TELEPHONE AND HhTURNTHEORIGlNALMESSAGE TOUS
VIATHEU.S. POSTAL SERV10E.WE Wil l SE HAPPYTOREMITTHEPOSTAGECOST DACKTOYOU,

RECEIVED
JAN2 8 2005

DIV.OFOlL,GAS&



08/15/2005 13:39 FAX 918 599 9401 EXACT Engineering Inc l 002/002

STATEOF UTAH FORM6
DEPARTMENTOF NATURAI. RESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITYACTION FORM

Operator: WolverineGas and 011Company of Utah, LLC Operator Account Number: N 1655

Address: 55 Campau NW, One Riverfront Plaza

city Grand Rapids

state MI ¡¡p 49503-2616 Phone Number: (616)458-1150

Well i

API Number Well Name QQ sec Twp Rng County
4304130032 WolverineFederal 20-1 NWNW 20 23S 1W Sevier

Action.Code Current Ent1ty Now Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

A 8/9/2005
Comments: SHLSESWSec17 pam CONROUBL

wellAPI
Number Well Name 00 Sec Twp Rng county

Action Code Gurrent Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number EfFeetive Date

Commente:

WeirMI
Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp RnH county

Action Code Curreitt grttity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effootive Date

Comments:

ACTION CODES:
A - Establish neW entityfor new well (singlewell only) George C. Nicely - EXACT Engineering inc

B - Addnew well to existing entity (groupor unit well) Name (PIO Å nt)
C - Re-assign well from one existingentityto another existingentity •

D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity signature
a - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) Engineering Technician 8/15/2005

Title Date



\

EIAIITEngineering,lac. WWILOXSCt0MilDOOrlDS.80BI

415 S. Boston Ave., Suite 734, Tulsa, OK 74103 • (918) 599-9400 • (918) 599-9401 (fax)

Steven R. Hash, P.E.
Registered Professional Engineer
stevehash@exactengineering.com

CONFlDENTIAL PLEASE!

August 15, 2005

Mr. Dustin Doucet
Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Re: Wolverine Federal 20-1 well
Sec 17 T23S RO1W
Sevier Co., UT
API# 43-041-30032

Dear Mr. Doucet,

On behalf of WolverineGas and OilCompany of Utah, LLC,please find enclosed daily drilling reports for the
subject well from August 8, 2005 throughAugust 13, 2005. The well spud at 07:30 am on August 9, 2005 and
we are presently drilling at 2025'. We respectfully request that the enclosed information remain confidential.

Very Truly Y urs,

Chris Nicely
Engineering Technician

Enclosures

copy without enclosures via email to:
Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC: Helene Bardolph
EXACT Engineering, Inc. well file

ECEiVED
AUGi 8 2005

PetroleuniEngineeringConsulting,Personnela lobsite Supervision
complete well design, construction & management, drilling, completion, production, pipelines, appraisals,

due diligence, acquisitions, procedures, temporary personnel and field



Engineering & Supervision EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) 599-osoo

Operator: Wolverine GSO Co of Utah, LLC »AIL.YDRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnightto midnight

DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUO DATE API# SUPERVISOR

08/13/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 Rodger Rebsom

DAYS FI SPUD PRESENTOPERATIONS@MIDNIGHT TOTALDEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMATION AUTH DEPTH

5 DRILLING 2,080 270 23.50 11.5 Arapian 7170 md

MUbbAIA
WT VIS. WL CK PH SAND SOLIDS%PV YP GELS DEPTHOATETTIMECHLORIDESCALCIUMMBTSALTPPM

9.9 36 2/32 8.5 0,50 7.00 6 21 11/20 1913 8/13-0800 50,000 680 82,500

kll DAIA
BlT SIZE MFG TYPE lADC SERIAL NO JETS (1/32ncr) IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULL CONO TION

NO. CODE or TFA
RT+MTR

1 17.500 VAREL V-41 638083 4 X 24 120 1960 104.00 18.8 Y 30-120 36

#VALUE!
#DIVIO!

#DIVl0!

HYDRAULlÒ$ ŠLOW PUMP

PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE GALI STW SPM GPM AV DP AVDC PUMP MTR DIFF HHP / IN2 ECD m

NO. LENGTH PRESS. PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 100 310 93 108 1425 250 1

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 100 310 2

3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 100 310 3

DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO

BOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY LENGTH O D. I.D. FORMATlON MD TVD LITHOLOGY RIG INFO

BIT 1.50 17.500 SURFACE Rig No Unit 111

MOTOR 27.96 X-OVER 2.870 Cell Ncrren 918-645-6671

X-OVER 3.04 3-5/8"HSW 150.880 Last BOP Test
GAsbAIA

IBS-REAMER 5.65 X-OVER 2.4õ BOT TOMSUP TIME BG GAS CONN GAS TRIPGAS 14 AÊ606 I oÊ

UBHO 2.58 19-5"HSW 576.380 Last Safety Meeting 8/13
SHOWS

MONEL 31.86 JARS 31. GASUNITS FROM TO ROP(FT/HR) Lual BOF Didl

MONEL 30.70 3-5"HWDP 89.280 Last Operate Pipe Rar

PONY MONEL 10.08 Last Operate BlindRa

SHOCK SUB. 11.80 : :-: : :-: Last Operate Annular

STRLNG WT. BHA WT. PU WT. 80 WT ROT TORQUE GRD. ELEVATION GL TO KB KBELEVATION INTERMED1ATECSG LAST CASING NEXT3ASING

91,000 58,000 115,000 80,000 240 5,839 17 5,856 20" @120' 13.375 @ 250C

SUkVl-vs
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECT10N N+ / S- E+IW- DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+ / S- E+ /W- DLS TOOL

1,843 12.80 229.00 1827 184 -159 -96 2.54 MWD 2,032 17.50 237.60 2009 231 -188
-136 2.98 MWD

1,937 14.90 233.60 1919 206 -173 -114 2.52 MWD
DAILY AclMI Y

FROM LAST24 HOURS:

0:00 17:00 17.00 DRILL FROM 1810' TO 2025'
17:00 17:3o o.So SERVICE RIG
17:30 0:00 6.50 DRILL FROM 2025' TO 2080'

AUS1 8 2005
DNOF GA3&



Engineering &Supervision EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) soo-94oo

Operator: Wolverine GRO Co of Utah, LLC -AILY DRI LLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnightto midnight
DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE API# SUPERVISOR

08/12/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 Rodger Rebsom
DAYSFISPUD PRÊSENTOPERATIOÑSg MIDNIGHT TOTALDEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMAT10N AUTH. OEPTH

4 DRILLING 1,810 423 23.50 18.0 Arapian 7170 md

MUbDAIA
WT VIS WL CK PH SAND SOUDS% PV YP GELS DEPTH DATEITIME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MBT SALTPPM

9.5 34 2/32 7.5 0.50 7.00 5 17 10/19 1537 8/12-0800 30,000 400 49,500

MIIDAIA
BIT SIZE MFG. TYPE lADC SERIAL NO JETS (1/32n ) IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULL CONDlTlON

NO CODE orTFA RT+MTR T B G

1 17.500 VARE V-41 638083 4 X 24 120 1690 80.50 21.0 Y 30-120 36

#VALUE!
#DIVIO!

#DIVl0!

HYDRAULIÒŠ $LÓW PUMP
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE GAL I STK SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MTR DIFF HHP / IN2 ECD 67 sm 76 sm 100 sm

NO. LENGTH PRESS. PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 100 310 93 108 1275 250 1

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 100 310 2

3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 100 310 3

DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO
BOTTOMHOLEASSEMBLY LENGTH O.D. I D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHOLOGY RIG INFO

BIT 1,50 17.500 SURFACE Rig No Unit 111

MOTOR 27,96 X-OVER 2.870 Cell Ncrren 918-645-6671

X-OVER 3.04 3-Sl8"HSW 150.880 Last BOP Test
GAsoAiA

IBS-REAMER 5.65 X-OVER 2.460 BOTTOMBUPTIME BGGAS CONNGAS TRPGAs Next BOP Tal

UBHO 2.58 19-S"HSW 576.380 Last Safety Meeting 8/12
si-loWs

MONEL 31.86 JARS 32.ô30 GASUNlTS FROM TO ROP(FT)HR) Lal BOF Diill

MONEL 30.70 3-5"HWDP 89.280 Last Operate Pipe Rat

PONY MONEL 10.08 Last Operate BlindRa

SHOCK SUB. 11.80 : :-:- :-: : Last Operate Annular
STAINé WT. BHA WI. PUWT SO WT ROT TORQUE GRD ELEVATION GL TO KB KBELEVATION INTERMEDIATECSG LASTCASING NEXT :ASING

86,000 58,000 100,000 75,000 235 5,839 17 5,856 20" @120' 13.375 @2500

SUkvkvs
MD INCL AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+ / S- E+ / W- DLS TOOL MO INCL AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+ / S- E+ / W- DLS TOOL

1,465 11.40 204.00 1457 110 -99 -53 1.01 MWD 1,654 10.90 216.00 1642 146 -130 -71 1.40 MWD

1,560 11.30 209.00 1550 128 -115 -61 1.10 MWD 1,748 11.30 219.00 1734 164 -145 -82 0.87 MWD

DAILYAullvily
FROM LAST24 HOURS:

0:00 17:00 17.00 DRILL FROM 1387' TO 1710'
17:00 17:30 0.50 SERVICE RIG
17:30 0:00 6.50 DRILL FROM 1710' TO



Engineering & Supervision EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) 599-9400

Operator: Wolverine GRO Co of Utah, LLC MAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight

DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE APt# SUPERVISOR

08/11/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 Rodger Rebsom

DAYS FI SPUD PRESENTOPERATIONS @MIDNIGHT TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMATION AUTH. OEPTH

3 DRILLING 1,387 550 23.50 23.4 Arapian 7170 md

MUbbAIA
WT VIS WL CK PH SAND SOLIDS%PV YP GELS DEPTHDATETTIMECHLORIDESCALCIUMMBTSALTPPM

9.5 32 2/32 8.5 0.50 6.75 4 13 9/14 1048 8/11-0800 30,000 360 49,500

bil DAIA
BIT SIZE MFG. TYPE IADC SERLAL NO. JETS Ol32ntr) IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULL CONDIT1ON

NO. CODE or TFA
RT+MTR

1 17.500 VAREL V-41 638083 4 X 24 120 1267 57.00 22.2 Y 30-120 20

#VALUE!
#DIVIO!

#DIVIO!

HV0RAULlÓŠ $LÒW PUMP

PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE GAL I STN SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MTR DIFF HHP / IN2 ECD IT1

NO. LENGTH PRESS. PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 100 310 93 108 1275 250 1

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 100 310 2

3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 100 310 3

DRILLSTRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO

BOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY LENGTH O.D. LD. FORMATION MD TVO LITHOLOGY RIG INFO

BIT 1.50 17.500 SURFACE Rig No Unit 111

MOTOR 27.96 X-OVER 2.870 Cell Ncrren 918-646-6671

X-OVER 3.04 3-5/8"HSW 150.880 Last BOP Test
GASDAIA

IBS-REAMER 5.65 X-OVER 2.460 BOT10MSUPIIME BGGAS CONNGAS TRIPGAS ^ I M

UBHO 2.58 19-5"HSW 576.380 Last Safety Meeting 8/11
SHOWS

MONEL 31.86 JARS 32.000 (ASUNils FROM IU ROP(FUHN) LolDOFDaill

MONEL 30.70 3-5"HWDP 89.280 Last Operate Pipe Rat

PONY MONEL 10.08
Last Operate BlindRa

SHOCK SUB. 11.80 :-: :
Last Operate Annular

S1RINGWT. BHAWT PUWE SOWT ROT.IOROUE GRDELEVATION GLTOKB KBELEVATION INTERMIDlATECSG LASTCAS1NG NEXTJASlNG

80,000 58,000 100,000 75,000 235 5,839 17 5,856 20" @ 120' 13.375 @250C

SUkv6vs
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+/S- E+/W- DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+/S- E+/W- DLS TOOL

994 6.90 206,00 993 32 -28 -17 1.40 mwd 1,182 9.10 207.00 1179 58 -50 -29 1.34 mwd

1,088 7.90 210.00 1086 44 -38
-22 1.16 mwd 1,276 10.10 207.80 1272 73 -65 -36 1.06 mwd

l>AILYAcilvily
FROM LAST 24 HOURS:

0:00 14:30 14.50 DRILL FROM 83T TO 1206'
14:30 15:00 0.50 SERVICE RIG
15:oo o:oo 9.00 DRILL FROM 1206' TO



Engineering & Supervision EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) ses-94oo

Operator: Wolverine GRO Co of Utah, LLC -AILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnightto midnight

DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE API# SUPERVISOR

08/10/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 Rodger Rebsom
DAYSF/ SPUD PRESENTOPERATIONS@MIDNiGHT TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DR1LLINGTIME ROP FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH

2 DRILLING 837 356 18.00 19.8 Arapian 7170 md

MUbbAIA
WT VIS. WL CK PH SAND SOLIDS% PV YP GELS DEPTH DATEITIME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MBT SALTPPM

8.6 27 12.0 31,000 380

BIlDAIA
BIT S1ZE MFG TYPE lADC SERIALNO. JETS(1f32ncr) IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULLCONDITION

NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B

1 17.500 VAREL V-41 638083 4 X 24 120 717 33.50 21.4 Y 30-120 20

#VALUE!
#DIVIO!

#DIVIO!

HYDRAULlóŠ ŠLOW PUMP

PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE GAL I STN SPM GPM AVDP AVDC PUMP MTRDIFF HHP11N2 ECD

NO. LENGTH PRESS. PRESS,

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 110 316 52/60 1050 250 1

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 110 316 2

3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 3

DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO

BOTTOMHOLEASSEMBLY LENGTH O.D I.D FORMATION MD TVD LITHOLOGY RIG1NFO

BIT 1.50 17.500 SURFACE Rig No Unit 111

MOTOR 27.96 X-OVER 2.870 Cell Ncrren 918-645-6671

X-OVER 3.04 3-5/8"HSW 150.880 Last BOP Test
GASDAIA

IBS-REAMER 5.65 X-OVER 2.4ÜO 901IOMSUPIIME BGGAS CONNGAS TRIPGAs NextBOFTel

UBHO 2.58 19-5"HSW 576.380 Last Safety Meeting 8/10
SHUWS

MONEL 31.86 JARS 32.03G UASUNIIS PROM TO ROP(E1/HH) Lei r ÛIlil

MONEL 30.70 3-5"HWDP 89.280 Last Operate Pipe Rai

PONY MONEL 10.08 Last Operate BlindRa

SHOCK SUB. 11.80 : : : : : Last Operate Annutar
STRING WV BHAWT. PU WI SO WT. ROT. TORQUE GRD ELEVATION GL TO KB KB ELEVATION INTERMEDATECSG LAST CASING NEXT 3ASING

65 45 75 60 225 5,839 17 5,856 20" @120' 13.375 @250C

MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+/S- E+/W- DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+/S- E+IW- OLS TOOL

539 1.70 218.00 538 1 -3 1 1.34 MWD 720 3.10 218.00 719 9 -8 -4 0.89 MWD

629 2.30 221.00 628 4 -5 -1 0.68 MWD 812 4.20 220.00 811 15 -13 -8 1.21 MWD

DAILYAcllUllV
FROM LAST24 HOURS:

o:oo 10:30 10.50 DRILL FROM 481' TO 685'
10:30 11:00 0.50 SERVICE RIG
11:00 12:00 1.00 DRILL FROM 685' TO 715'
12:00 12:30 o.50 CIRC. TEST MWD FAILED
12:30 17:30 5.00 TRIP OUT-CHANGE OUT MWD-TRIP IN
17:30 0:00 6.50 DRILL FROM 715' TO



Engineering &Supervision EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) sos-94oo

Operator: Wolverine G&O Co of Utah, LLC vAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnightto midnight
DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE API# SUPERVISOR

08/09/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier. UT 43-041-30032 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS F/SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @MIDNIGHT TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS ORILLINGTIME ROP FORMATION AUTH DEPTH

1 DRILLING 481 361 15.50 23.3 Arapian 7170 md

MUbDAIA
WT VLS WL CK PH SAND SOLIDS% PV YP GELS DEPTH DATETTlME CHLORiDES CALCIUM MBT SALTPPM

8.6 27 12.0 31,000 380

911DAIA
BIT SIZE MFG. TYPE IADC SERIALNO. JETS (1/32nd") IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULL CONOIT10N

NO CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B G

1 17.500 VAREL V-41 638083 4 X 24 120 361 15.50 23.3 Y 30-120 20

#VALUE!
#DIVIOI

#DIVIO!

HYDRAULIÒS ŠLOW PUMP

PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE GAL I STK SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MTR DiFF HHP / IN2 Eco 67 sm 76 sm gm
NO. LENGTH PRESS. PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 110 316 52/60 650 225 1

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 110 316 2

3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 3

DRILLSTRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO
BOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY LENGTH OD i.D FORMATION MD TVD L1THOLOGY RIG [NFO

BIT 1.50 17.500 Arapiean Rig No Unit 111

MOTOR 27.96 Twin Creek Cell Ncrren 918-645-6671

X-OVER 3.04 Navajo Last BOP Test
GASUAIA

IBS-REAMER 5.65 BOTTOMSUPTlME BGGAS CONNGAS TRIPGAs NexlBOFTesl

UBHO 2.58 Last Safety Meeting 8/9
SHUWS

MONEL 31.86 GASUNIIS FROM TO ROP(FT/HR) Lal BOF Diill

MONEL 30.70 Last Operate Pipe Rai

PONY MONEL 10.08 Last Operate BlindRa

SHOCK SUB. 11.80 :-: : : : : : : :-:.: Last Operate Annular
STRINGWL BHA WE. PU WT SO WT NU1. TORQUE GRD. ELEVATION GLTO KB KBELEVATION INTi-HMEDIATE CSG LASTCASING NI-XT3ASING

65 45 75 60 225 5,839 17 5,856 20" @120' 13.375 @250C

SUkv6vs
MO INCL AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+ / S- E+ IW- DLS TOOL MD INCL AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+ l S- E+ / W- DLS TOOL

173 0.50 108.00 173 0 1 0.29 357 0.10 201.00 357 -1 2 0.99

266 0.90 112.00 266 -1 2 0.43 448 0.50 231.00 448 -1 2 0.46

DAILY AulIVIlv
FROM LAST24 HOURS

c:oo 3:oo 3.00 WELD ON CONDUCTOR - IN STALL ROTATING HEAD
3:00 7:30 4.50 PICK - MAKE UP - BHA - TEST SAME.
7:30 8:30 1.00 SPUD - DRILL FROM - 120 TO 145'
8:30 9:30 1.00 SERVICE RIG - WORK ON KELLY SPINNERS.
9:30 0:00 14.50 DRILL - 145' TO



Engineering & Supervisíon EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) soo-94oo
Operator: Wolverine Gao Co of utah,LLC -AILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnightto midnight
DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTV. STATE SPUD DATE APl# SUPERVISOR

08/08/00 Wolverine Federal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier, UT 43-041-30032 Rodger Rebsom
DAYSFI SPUO PRESENT OPERATIONS@MIDNIGHT TOTALDEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMATION AUTH DEPTH

0 Rig up 120 0 0.00 #DIVIO! Arapian 7170 md
MUbDAIA

WT VIS WL CK PH SAND SOLIOS% PV YP GELS DEPTH DATEITIME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MBT SALTPPM

611bAIA
BIT SIZE MFG TYPE IADC SERIALNO. JETS(1/32nd') IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULLCONOITlON
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B G

#VALUE!
#VALUE!
#DIVl0!

#DIVl0!

HYDRAULIÒS ŠLÓW PUMP
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE GAL/ST SPM GPM AVDP AVOC PUMP MTRDIFF HHP/IN2 ECD 67s m 76s m 100s m

NO. LENGTH PRESS. PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 1

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 2

3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 3

DRILLSTRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO
BOTTOMHOLEASSEMBLY LENGTH OD LD FORMATION MD TVO LITHOLOGY RIGINFO

Arapiean Rig No Unit 111

Twin Creek Cell Ncrren 918-645-6671

Navajo Last BOP Test
GAsl]AlA

BOTTOMSUP TIME BGGAS CONNGAS TRIP GAs Nexl BOF Teal

Last Safety Meeting 8/8
slioWs

GASUNITS FROM TO ROP(FT/HR) Lal BOF Diill

Last Operate Pipe Rat

Last Operate BlindRa
Total BHA: 997.98 : : Last Operate Annular
STR1NG WT BHA WT. PU W1 SO W HO1. TOHOUE GRD ELEVATION GL TO KB KB ELEVATION INTERMEDIATE CSG LAST CASING NEXT ASING

5,839 17 5,856 20" @120' 13.375 @2500

N+/S- E+/W- DLS TOOL

MDhUIM-Ÿs
E+/W- DLS TOOL

DAILYAcilvilv
FROM LAST 24 HOURS:

0:00 0:00 24.00 Finish rig move, Rig



EHiiTEnginearlBE,Inc. .....x.ct...i...ri.......

415 S. Boston Ave., Suite 734, Tulsa, OK 74103 • (918) 599-9400 • (918) 599-9401 (fax)

Steven R. Hash, P E.
Registered Pmfessional Engineer
stevehash@exactengineedng.com

CONFIDENTIAL PLEASE!

August 29, 2005

Mr. Dustin Doucet
Utah Division of Oil,Gas &Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Re: Wolverine Federal 20-1 well
Sec 17 T23S RO1W
Sevier Co., UT
API#43-041-30032

Dear Mr. Doucet,

On behalf of Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC, please find enclosed daily drilling reports for the

subject wellfrom August 22, 2005 throughAugust 28, 2005. Our depth is 6361' and we are preparing to run

9-5/8" casing. We respectfully request that the enclosed information remain confidential.

Very Trul Yours,

Chris Nicely
Engineering Technician

Enclosures

copy withoutenclosures via email to:
Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC: Helene Bardolph
EXACT Engineering, Inc. wellfile

REC VED
SEPOI 2005

PetroleuinEngineeringCensulting,Personnela labsite Supersislen

complete well design, construction &management, drilling, completion, production, pipelines, appraisals,

due diligence, acquisitions, procedures, temporarypersonnel and field



Engineering &Supervisior EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) 599-94oo

Operator: WolverineGaocoofutah,LLC DAILYDRILLING REPORT 24hrs-midnighttomidnight

DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE APW SUPERVISOR

08/28/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 UnitRig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 George Urban

DAYS Fl SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ MIDNIGHT TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH

20 RUN 9 5/8" CASING 6,361 158 11.50 13.7 Arapian 7170 md

MUDDAIA
WT VIS. WL CK PH SAND SOUDS % PV YP GELS DEPTH DATETTIME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MBT SALT PPM

10.4 31 NC 2/32 6.8 0 50 5.00 5 5 4/8 6305 8/28/0800 165,000 3480 272,250

Bil DAIA
BIT SIZE MFG. TYPE IADC SERIAL NO. JETS /32nd") IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULLCONDITION

NO. CODE or TFA
RT+MTR

6 12.25 REED HPS3A 537 PB4408 24 24 24 4027 5917 1890 75.50 25.0 Y 30/140 40/45 4 3 IN

7/5 12.25 REED RR-HP53A 537 PB4407 24 24 24 5917 6361 444 23.00 19.3 Y 30/140 45 3 3 -1/16

HYDRAULlÔ$ ŠLOW PUMP

PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE GAL/ STK SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MTR DIFF HHP / IN' ECD

NO. LENGTH PRESS. PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 340 140 154 1850 200 1 280

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 340 2 200

3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 3

DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO

BOTTOMHOLEASSEMBLY LENGTH O.D. I.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHOLOGY RIG INFO

BIT 1.50 12.250 TWIN CREEK 6,154 5,730 LS-100% Rig No Unit111

MOTOR 23.10 X-OVER 2.870 Cell Norren 918-645-6671

UBHO 3.25 6-5/8"HSW 150.880 Last BOP Test 8/17
GASDAIA

MONEL 31.10 X-OVER 2.400 so! TOMS UP TlME BG GAS CONN GAS TRIP GAS Next DOP Teal 9/17

PONY MONEL 10.08 19-5"HSW 576.380 Last Safety Meeting 8/28

SHOCKSUB. 11.80 JARS 32.000 GASUN11S FROM 10 ROP(FTlHR) LealDOFDiill 8/28

3-5"HWDP 89.280 Last Operate Pipe Rar 8/28

Last Operate Blind Rai 8/28

BHA.= 963.89 : : : :
Last Operate Annular 8/28

STRING Vff. BHAWT. PU WT. SO WT ROT TORQUE GRD. ELEVATION GL TO KB KB ELEVATION INÍERMEDIATE CSG LASI CASING NEXÍ3ASING

172 58,000 235 140 180 5,839 17 5,856 13.375 @2440 9.625

bUkv6vb
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+ / S- E+ / W- DLS TOOL MD INCL AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+ / S- E+ I W DLS TOOL

6,250 12.50 220.10 5822 2000 -1520 -1299 5.37 MWD MWD

6,316 12.10 214.40 5887 2014 -1532 -1308 1.94 MWD

DAILYAUTWirt
FROM LAST 24 HOURS:

0:00 11:30 11.50 DRILLFROM 6203' TO 636f CASING TD.

11:30 12:30 1.oo CIRC. PUMP SWEEP TO SURFACE
12:30 14:00 1.so SHORT TRIP 10 STANDS
14:00 15:00 1.00 CIRC. PUMP SLUG
15:00 19:30 4,50 POOH
19:30 21:00 1.50 LYlDN6 5/8 HWDP, 8' MONELS, MUD MOTOR AND BIT.

21:00 22:00 1.oo HSM AND RIG UP FRANKS CASING CREW.

22:00 0:00 2.00 RUN 9 5/8" CASING.

THIS AM RUNNINGCASING

Daily Total



Engineering & Supervisior EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) 599-94oo

Operator: wolverineG&OCo of Utah, LLC DAILYDRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight

DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE APIS SUPERVISOR

08/27/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 George Urban

DAYS FI SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ MIONIGHT TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH

19 DRILLING 6,203 286 11.50 24.9 Arapian 7170 md

MUbDAIA
WT VIS. WL CK PH SAND SOUDS% PV YP GELS DEPTH DATETTIME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MST SALTPPM

10.3 31 NC 2/32 9.5 0.50 5.25 5 5 4/6 5395 8/26/0800 155,000 3640 255,750

bli DAIA
BIT StZE MFG. TYPE lADC SERIAL NO, JETS (1/32nd") IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULLCONDITION

NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR

6 12.25 REED HPS3A 537 PB4408 24 24 24 4027 5917 1890 75.50 25.0 Y 30/140 40/45 4 3 IN

7/5 12.25 REED RR-HP53A 537 PB4407 2A 24 24 5917 286 11.50 24.9 Y 30/140 45

HYORAULIÖŠ ŠLOWPUMÞ

PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE GAL / STK SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MTR DIFF HHP I IN' ECD

NO. LENGTH PRESS. PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 340 140 154 1850 200 1 280

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 340 2 200

3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 3

DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO

BOTTOMHOLEASSEMBLY LENGTH O.D. I.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHOLOGY RIG INFO

BIT 1.50 12.250 Rig No Unit111

MOTOR 23.10 X-OVER 2.870 Cell Norren 918-645-6671

UBHO 3.25 6-5/8"HSW 150.880 Last BOP Test 8/17
GAsbAIA

MONEL 31.10 X-OVER 2.400 BOTIOMSUPIIME BGGAS CONNGAS TRIPGAs NextSOFTeal 9/17

PONY MONEL 10.08 19-5"HSW 576.380 Last Safety Meeting 8/27
shoWs

SHOCK SUB. 11.80 JARS 32.03û GASUNITS I-ROM TO ROP(FT/HR) Lesl BOF Diill 8/27

3-5"HWDP 89.280 Last Operate Pipe Rar 8/27

Last Operate Blind Rat 8/27

BHA.= 963.89
Last Operate Annular 8/27

STRING WT. SHA WT. PU WT. SO WT. ROT TOROUE GRD. ELEVATION GLTO KB KB ELEVATION INTERMEDIATEÒSG LASÌCASING NEXT 3ASING

172 58,000 235 140 180 5,839 17 5,856 13.375 @2440 9.625

MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+ / S- E+ / W- DLS TOOL MD INCL AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+ / S- E+ / W- DLS TOOL

5,966 18.10 233.60 5551 1918 -1464 -1238 2.01 MWD 6,155 17.30 226.90 5730 1975 -1503 -1282 1.17 MWD

6,060 18.40 227,30 5640 1946 -1483 -1261 2.12 MWD

bAILY Acnvity
FROM LAST 24 HOURS:

0:00 2:00 2.00 POOH
2:00 5:30 3.50 PKlUP GAMMATEST NO TEST WORK ON GAMMATOOL, MKlUP BIT, TEST OK.

5:30 8:00 2.50 TIH
a:oo 9:oo 1.00 KELLYUP WASH AND REAM 40' TO BOTTOM & SURVEY.

9:00 12:30 3.so RIG SERVICE
12:30 0:00 11.50 DRILLFROM 6042' TO 6203' SEPO1 pgg

THIS AM 6290'

Daily Total



Engineering &Supervisior EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) ses-94oo
Operator: WolverineG&OCoofUtah,LLC DAILYDRILLING REPORT 24hrs-midnighttomidnight

DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE API# SUPERVISOR

08/26/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 George Urban
DAYS FI SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ MIDNIGHT TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH

18 POOH 5,917 777 21.00 37.0 Arapian 7170 md
MUbDAIA

WT VIS. WL CK PH SAND SOLIDS% PV YP GELS DEPTH DATETTIME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MBT SALTPPM

10.5 32 NC 2/32 10.0 0.50 5.30 5 7 5/9 5917 8/27/0800 177,000 3750 292,050

Bli DAIA
BIT SIZE MFG. TYPE IADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd") IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULLCONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B G

6 12.25 REED HP53A 537 PB4408 24 24 24 4027 5917 1890 75.50 25.0 Y 30/140 40/45
#DIVl0!

HVÒRAULICS 8LOW PUMP
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE GAL/ STK SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MTR DIFF HHP / IN ECD 68 sm 61 sm 75 sm

NO. LENGTH PRESS. PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 340 140 154 1850 200 1 220

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 340 2 200
3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 3

DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO
BOTTOMHOLEASSEMBLY LENGTH O.D I.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHOLOGY RIG INFO

BIT 1.50 12.250 Rig No Unit111

MOTOR 23.10 X-OVER 2.870 Cell Norren 918-645-6671

UBHO 3.25 6-5/8"HSW 150.880 Last BOP Test 8/17
GAsbAIA

MONEL 31.10 X-OVER 2.400 BOTlOMS UP llME BG GAS CONN GAS TRIP GAs Nexl DOP Test 9/17

PONY MONEL 10.08 19-5"HSW 576.380 Last Safety Meeting 8/26

SHOCK SUB. 11.80 JARS 32.030 GASUNITS FHOM IO ROP(FT/HR) Lael DOP D.ill 8/26
3-5"HWDP 89.280 Last Operate Pipe Rar 8/24

Last Operate Blind Rat 8/24
BHA.= 963.89 : : : : : : : : : : ; Last Operate Annular 8/24

STRING WT. BHAWl. PU VWI. SO WT. ROT. TORQUE GRD. ELEVATION GL TO KB KB ELEVATION INIERMEDIATECSG LAST CASING NEAl 'ASING

168 58,000 220 135 180 5,839 17 5,856 13.375 @2440 9.625

bUkvbvb
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+/S- E+/W- DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+lS- E+IW- DLS TOOL

5,399 25.90 224.50 5027 1704 -1321 -1076 1.84 MWD 5,777 21.30 230.80 5373 1856 -1427 -1187 2.73 MWD
5,588 23.60 225.50 5200 1783 -1377 -1132 1.25 MWD 5,872 19.90 235.40 5462 1888 -1447 -1213 2.25 MWD

bAILY ACTIVITY
FROM LAST 24 HOURS:

0:00 13:00 13.00 DRILL& SURVEY FROM 5140' TO 5601'
13:00 13:30 0.50 RIG SERVICE
13:30 16:00 2.50 DRILL& SURVEY FROM 5601' TO 5664'
16:00 16:30 0.50 LOST RIG AIR WORK ON AIR COMPRESSOR.
16:30 22:00 5.50 DRILL& SURVEY FROM 5664' TO 5917'

100% SLIDE FROM 5664' TO 5917' (252') HOLE WANTS TO TURN WEST
22:00 23:00 1.00 CIRCULATE AND PUMP HI-VISE SWEEP TO SURFACE, PUMP SLUG.
23:00 0:00 1.00 POOH FOR SHARP BITAND GAMMA.

SEPU12005

THIS AM TIH

Daily l otal



Engineering & Supervisio, EXACT Engineering, InC. (918) 599-9400

Operator: Wolverine G&OCo of Utah, LLC DAILYDRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight

DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE API# SUPERVISOR

08/25/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 George Urban
DAYS FI SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ MIDNJGHT TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH

17 DRILLING 5,140 389 18.50 21.0 Arapian 7170 md
MUDDAIA

WT VIS. WL CK PH SAND SOLIDS% PV YP GELS DEPTH DATEITIME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MBT SALTPPM

10.1 31 NC 2/32 8.8 0.50 5.75 4 8 4/10 4785 8/25/0800 118,000 32000 194,700

Bll DAIA
BIT StZE MFG. TYPE lADC SERIAL NO JETS (1/32nd") IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULLCONDITION

NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B

6 12.25 REED HP53A 537 PB4408 24 24 24 4027 1113 54.50 20.4 Y 30/140 40/45

#DIVIO!

HYDRAULIÒ$ $LóWÞUMP
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE GAL/ STK SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MTR DIFF HHP / IN' ECD 68 sm 61 sm 75 sm

NO. LENGTH PRESS. PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 1850 200 1 240

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 2 200

3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 3

DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO
BOTTOMHOLEASSEMBLY LENGTH O.D I.D. FORMATION MD TVD L1THOLOGY RIG INFO

BIT 1.50 12.250 Rig No Unit 111

MOTOR 23.10 X-OVER 2.870 Cell Norren 918-645-6671

UBHO 3.25 6-5/8"HSW 150.880 Last BOP Test 8/17
GAsbAIA

MONEL 31.10 X-OVER 2.400 BOTTOMS UP TIME BG GAS CONN GAS IRIP GAS Next DOF Teal 9/17

PONY MONEL 10.08 19-5"HSW 576.380 Last Safety Meeting 8/25

SHOCKSUB. 11.80 JARS 32.03G GASUNIIS EROM 10 ROP(FilHR) LealBOFDiill 8/25

3-5"HWDP 89.280 Last Operate Pipe Rar 8/24

Last Operate Blind Rat 8/24

BHA.= 963.89 :-: : : : -:-:-: : Last Operate Annular 8/24
STRING WT. BHA WI PU W I. SO WT. ROT. TORQUE GRD. ELEVATION GL TO KB KB ELEVATION INTERMEDIATECSG LAST CASING NEXÝ:ASING

152 58,000 205 125 180 5,839 17 5,856 13.375 @ 2440 9.625

MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+/S- E+/W- DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+lS- E+/W- DLS TOOL

4,738 28.10 215.10 4443 1395 -1079 -884 0.84 MWD 5,021 28.20 216.60 4694 1527 -1187 -960 1.16 MWD

4,832 27.40 215.50 4527 1438 -1114 -909 0.77 MWD 5,115 29.50 218.70 4776 1572 -1223 -988 1.75 MWD

bAILY ÁClÑlÌV
FROM LAST 24 HOURS:

0:00 0:3o 0.50 FINISH POOH FOR MWD
0:30 2:00 1.50 LYlDNMWD PK/UP NEW MWD CK BITAND MOTOR AND TEST.
2:00 4:30 2.50 TIH
4:30 5:00 0.50 KELLYUP WASH 40' TO BOTTOM
5:00 10:00 5.00 DRILL& SURVEY FROM 4751' TO 4846'
10:00 10:30 0.50 RIG SERVICE
10:30 0:00 13.50 DRILL& SURVEY FROM 4846' TO 5140' GEPO1 200b

THIS AM DRILLING@5330'

Dailylotal



Engineering & Supervisior EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) sas-94oo
Operator: Wolverine G&OCo of Utah, LLC DAILYDRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight

DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE APW SUPERVISOR

08/24/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 George Urban
DAYS FI SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ MIDNIGHT TOTALDEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FÒRMATION AUTH. DEPTH

16 POOH 4,751 377 19.00 19.8 Arapian 7170 md

MUDDAIA
WT VIS. WL CK PH SAND SOLIDS% PV YP GELS DEPTH DATEITIME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MBT SALTPPM

10.0 31 NC 2/32 10.0 0.50 5.20 3 11 5/12 4538 8/24/0800 117,000 32000 193,050

Bll DAIA
BIT SIZE MFG. TYPE IADC SERlAL NO. JETS (1/32nd') IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULLCONDITION
NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B G

6 12.25 REED HP53A 537 PB4408 24 24 24 4027 724 36.00 20.1 Y 30/140 40/45

#DIVIO!

WYDRAULIÒ$ ŠLOWPUMP
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE GAL/ STK SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MTR DIFF HHP / IN' ECD 69 sm 76 sm 75 sm

NO. LENGTH PRESS. PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 1750 125 1 280

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 2
3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 3 280

DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO
BOTTOMHOLEASSEMBLY LENGTH O.D. I.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHOLOGY RIGINFO

BIT 1.50 12.250 Rig No Unit 111

MOTOR 23.10 X-OVER 2.870 Cell Narren 918-645-6671

UBHO 3.25 6-5/8"HSW 150.880 Last BOP Test 8/17
GAsbAIA

MONEL 31.10 X-OVER 2.400 BOTTOMS UP TIME BG GAS CONN GAS TRIP GAs Nexl DGE Teal 9/17

PONY MONEL 10.08 19-5"HSW 576.380 Last Safety Meeting 8/24
slioWS

SHOCK SUB. 11.80 JARS 32.000 GASUNIIS FROM 10 ROP(FTlHR) La l BOF Diill 8/24
3-S"HWDP 89.280 Last Operate Pipe Rar 8/23

Last Operate Blind Rat 8/23
BHA.= 963.89 : :-:- :-: : : : :-:-: Last Operate Annular 8/23

STRING WI. BHAWl. PU WT. So WI. ROT. IORQUE GRD. ELEVATION GL TO KB KB ELEVATION INTERMEDIATECSG LAST CASING NEAl :ASING

145 58,000 198 120 200 5,839 17 5,856 13.375 @ 2440 9.625

sUO6vb
MD INCL. Az!MUTH TVD SECTION N+ / S- E+ / W- DLS TOOL MD INCL AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+ / S- E+ / W- DLS TOOL

4,360 26.60 214.40 4106 1224 -939 -785 0.78 MWD 4,549 26.20 216.00 4275 1309 -1008 -834 0.60 MWD

4,455 26.60 215.10 4191 1267 -974 -810 0.33 MWD MWD

bAILY ACTIvrry
FROM LAST 24 HOURS:

0:00 15:oo 15.00 DRILL& SURVEY FROM 4374' to 4657'
15:00 17:00 2.oo ClO PUMPS, NO SURVEY, CIO MWD TRANSDUCER, RIG SERVICE
17:00 21:00 4.00 DRILL& TRY TO SURVEY FROM 4657' TO 4751'
21:00 22:00 1.00 TRY SURVEY, MWD NOT WORKING, BUILDAND PUMP SLUG
22:00 0:00 2.00 POOH FOR MWD

SEPO1 2005

THIS AM DRILLING@4765'

Daily Iotal



Engineering & Supervisior EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) sas-94oo

Operator: WolverineGaocoofutah,LLC DAILYDRILLING REPORT 24hrs-midnighttomidnight

DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE APIS SUPERVISOR

08/23/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 George Urban
DAYS FI SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ MIDNIGHT TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH

15 Drilling 4,374 347 17.00 20.4 Arapian 7170 md

MUbDAIA
WT VIS. WL CK PH SAND SOLIDS% PV YP GELS DEÞTH DATEITIME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MBT SALTPPM

9.9 31 NC 2/32 9.0 0.50 5.50 3 9 4/9 4085 8/23/0800 110,000 3100 181,500

Bll DAIA
BIT SIZE MFG. TYPE IADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd") IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULLCONDITION

NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B G

6 12.25 REED HP53A 537 PB4408 24 24 24 4027 347 17.00 20.4 Y 30/140 40/45

#DIVIO!

HYbRAULICS BL WPUMP
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE GAL / STK SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MTR DIFF HHP / IN2 ECD

NO. LENGTH PRESS. PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 1750 125 1 280

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 2

3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 3 280

DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO
BOTTOMHOLEASSEMBLY LENGTH O.D. I.D. FORMATION MO TVD LITHOLOGY RIG INFO

BIT 1.50 12.250 Rig No Unit111

MOTOR 23.10 X-OVER 2.870 Cell Narren 918-645-6671

UBHO 3.25 6-5/8"HSW 150.880 Last BOP Test 8/17
GA5bAIA

MONEL 31.10 X-OVER 2.4GG BOTTOMSUP IIME BG GAS CONN GAS TRIP GAs Next DOF Teal 9/17

PONY MONEL 10.08 19-5"HSW 576.380 Last Safety Meeting 8/23
si-Ið s

SHOCKSUB. 11.80 JARS 32.ûGG GASUNIIS FROM TO ROP(FTlHR) LeslBOFDaill 8/23

3-5"HWDP 89.280 Last Operate Pipe Rar 8/23

Last Operate Blind Rai 8/23

BHA.= 963.89 : : : : : : : : : : : Last Operate Annular 8/23
STRING WP. BHAWi. PU WT. SO Wr. ROT TORQUE GRD. ELEVATION GL TO KB KB ELEVATION INTERMEDIAIk CSG LASI CASING NEXT 3ASING

140 58,000 180 120 200 5,839 17 5,856 13.375 @2440 9.625

bUkv6vb
MD INCL AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+/S- E+/W- DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+/S- E+lW- DLS TOOL

3,928 25.70 214.30 3769 1055 -797 -691 0.81 MWD 4,171 27.40 213.60 3938 1139 -868 -738 0.86 MWD

4,077 26.60 213.40 3854 1096 -832 -714 1.04 MWD 4,266 27.10 213.20 4023 1182 -904 -762 0.37 MWD

bAILY ÁCilVIIY
FROM LAST 24 HOURS:

0:00 0:30 0.50 TEST MWD AND MOTOR MAKEUP BIT
0:30 3:00 2.50 TIH
3:00 3:30 0.50 REAM FROM 3953' TO 4027'
3:30 6:00 2.50 DRILL12 1/4" HOLE FROM 4027' TO 4085'

6:00 9:00 3.oo WELD ON 4" MUD LINE UNDER THE SUB.
9:00 16:00 7.00 DRILL& SURVEY FROM 4085' TO 4216'
16:00 16:30 0.50 RIG SERVICE
16:30 0:00 7.50 DRILL& SURVEY FROM 4216' TO 4374'

THIS AM DRILLING@4500

Daily Total 24.00



Engineering & Supervisior EXACTEngineering, Inc. (918) 599-94oo

Operator: Wolverine G&OCo of Utah, LLC DAILYDRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight

DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE APU SUPERVISOR

08/22/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 George Urban

DAYS FI SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ MIDNIGHT TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH

14 TlH 4,027 0 0.00 #DIVIO! Arapian 7170 md

MUbDAIA
WT VIS. WL CK PH SAND SOUDS % PV YP GELS DEPTH DATEITIME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MBT SALT PPM

9.9 31 NC 2/32 9.2 0.50 5.25 4 7 5/10 4027 8/22/0800 105,000 3080 173,250

bil DAlA
BIT SIZE MFG. TYPE lADC SERIAL NO. JETS (il32nd") IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULLCONDITION

NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T i

4 12.25 REED EHP-53A 537 5767 24 24 24 2709 3618 909 39,00 23.3 Y 30+132 35-40 6 2 -1/8

5 12.25 REED HPS3A 537 PB4407 24 24 24 3618 4027 409 16.00 25.6 Y 30/140 35-40 2 2 IN

6 12.25 REED HP53A 537 PB4408 24 24 24 4027

HYDRAULlÒS SLÓW AUMP

PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE GAL/ STK SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MTR DIFF HHP I IN ECD

NO. LENGTH PRESS. PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 1450 225 1 180

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 2 220

3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 3

DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO

BOTTOMHOLEASSEMBLY LENGTH O.D. I.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHOLOGY RIG INFO

BIT 1.50 12.250 Rig No Unit111

MOTOR 23.10 X-OVER 2.870 Cell Narren 918-645-6671

UBHO 3.25 6-5/8"HSW 150.880 Last BOP Test 8/17
GAsbAIA

MONEL 31.10 X-OVER 2.400 BO110MSUPIIME BGGAS CONNGAS TRIPGAS Nu^tBOFTeal 9/17

PONY MONEL 10.08 19-5"HSW 576.380 Last Safety Meeting 8/22

SHOCK SUB. 11.80 JARS 32.030 GAS UNITS FROM TO ROP (FT/HR) Last BOP Diill 8/22

3-5"HWDP 89.280 Last Operate Pipe Rar 8/22

Last Operate Blind Rat 8/22

BHA.= 963.89
Last Operate Annular 8/22

stRING WF. BHAWT. PU WT. SO Wi. ROT TORQUE GRD. ELEVATION GL TO KB KB ELEVATION INTERMEDIATECSG LAST CASING NEXT :ASING

130 58,000 160 115 235 5,839 17 5,856 13.375 @2440 9.625

MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+ / S- E+ / W- DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+ / S- E+ I W- DLS TOOL

MWD MWD

MWD MWD

DÅlLYACOVlÌY
FROM LAST 24 HOURS:

o:oo 5:oo 5.oo WAIT ON FISHING TOOLS.
5:oo 6:oo 1.00 MAKEUP FISHINGTOOLS
6:00 10:00 4.00 TIH WIFISHING TOOLS
10:00 12:00 2.oo WORK FISHING TOOLS STARTED TAKINGWT. 16' OFF BOTTOM

12:00 15:30 3.50 POOH WORK TIGHT SPOT AT 3005' NO FISH

15:30 16:00 0.50 CHANGE OUT LIP SHOE GUIDE
16:00 18:30 2.50 TIH WI FISHINGTOOL BHA#2
18:30 19:30 1.00 WORK FISHING TOOLS
19:30 22:00 2.So POOH
22:00 22:30 0.50 RETRIVE FISH AND LAYDOWN FISHING TOOLS

22:30 0:00 1.50 PICK UP DIRECTIONAL BHA

SFPO12005
THIS AM DRILLING@4080

Daily Iotal 24.00
g utl I



EXACT Engineering, Inc. www.exactengineering.com

415 S. Boston Ave., Suite 734, Tulsa, OK 74103 • (918) 599-9400 • (918) 599-9401 (fax)
I

Steven R. Hash, P.E.
Registemd Professional Engineer
stevehash@exactengineering.com

CONFIDENTIAL PLEASE!

September 6, 2005

Mr.Dustin Doucet
Utah Division of Oil,Gas & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City,UT 84114-5801

Re: WolverineFederal 20-1 well
Sec 17 T23S RO1W
Sevier Co., UT
API#43-041-30032

Dear Mr. Doucet,

On behalf ofWolverineGas and OilCompany of Utah, LLC, please find enclosed daily drilling reports for the

subject wellfrom August 29, 2005 throughSeptember 4, 2005. We have reached totaldepth of 7,158' and ran

and cemented 7" production casing. We respectfullyrequest that the enclosed information remain confidential.

Very T Yours,

Chris Nicely
EngineeringTechnician

Enclosures

copy without enclosures via email to:
Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC: Helene Bardolph
EXACT Engineering, Inc. well file

RECEIVED
SEPO9 2005

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING

Petroleum Engineering Consulting, Personnel & Jobsite Supervision

complete well design, construction & management, drilling, completion, production, pipelines, appraisals,

due diligence, acquisitions, procedures, temporary personnel and field



Engineering &Supervis,.., EXACTEngineering, Inc. (918) 599-9400

perator: Wolverine G&OCo of Utah, LLC DAILYDRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight

DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY,STATE SPUD DATE APU SUPERVISOR

09/04/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 NAYLOR-REBSOM

DAYSFI SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ MIDNIGHT TOTALDEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH

27 CUT OFF 7" CASING 7,158 0 0.00 #DIVIO! navajo 7170 md

MUUDAJA
WT VIS. WL CK PH SAND SOLIDS% PV YP GELS DEPTH DATEtrlME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MBT SALTPPM

8.5 35 8.0 1/32 8.8 0.50 1.10 5 7 4/8 7158 9/4/050800 3,400 140 5,610

Bil1)AIA
BIT SIZE MFG. TYPE IADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32mr) IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULLCONDITION

NO. CODE or TFA
RT+MTR

8 8.50 SEC EBXS30S 537 10686495 12 12 12 6361 6666 305 22.00 13.9 Y 30/120 40/45 8 E I

9 8.50 SEC ERA33 547 731186 14 14 14 6666 7158 492 22.50 21.9 Y 30/120 40/45 5 E I

RRE 8.50 SEC ERA33 547 731186 14 14 14 7158 7158 O 0.00 N 45 0 5 E l

HYDRAULICS SLow PUMP

PUMP MANUFACTURER UNER STROKE GALI STK SPM GPM AV DP AVDC PUMP MTR DIFF HHP I IN' ECD

NO. LENGTH PRESS. PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 120 355 1 460

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 2 400

3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 3

DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO

BOTTOMHOLEASSEMBLY LENGTH O.D. I.D. FORMATION MD TVD UTHOLOGY RIG INFO

TWIN CREEK 6,154 5,730 LS-100% Rig No Unit111

Navajo 6,465 6,032 Sand Cell Narren 918-645-6671

Last BOP Test 8/29
GAsbAIA

BOTTOMS UP TIME BG GAS CONN GAS TRIPGAs Next BOP Teal 9/29

Last Safety Meeting 9/4

GAsUNIIS FROM 70 NOP(H/HHy Leal BGP Daill 9/3

Last Operate Pipe Rar 9/3

Last Operate Blind Rat 9/3

Last Operate Annular 9/3

GTRINGWT. BHAWT. PU WT. 80 WT. ROT. TORQUE GRD. ELEVATION GL TO KB KB ELEVATION INTERMEDIATECSG LASTCASING NEXT :A$lNG

175,000 0 245,000 125,000 0 5,839 17 5,856 9.625 9.625 @6350' 7

LUkvkyb
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+/S- E+IW- DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+IS- E+lW- DLS TOOL

MWD

DAILYAclivlIV

FROM LAST24 HOURS:

o:oo 1:oo 1.00 FINISH LAYINGDOWN BHA.
1:00 8:30 7.50 RIG UP RUN 168 JOINTS 7" CASING-23#- P 110 - CASING SHOE SET g 7157'

8:30 11:30 3.00 RIG UP CIRC. CASING - WASH 8' TO BOTTOM2' FILL

11:30 13:30 2.00 RIG UP CEMENT PUMP 10 BBL KCL-20 BBLSUPERFLUSH-10 BBL KCL.FOLLOWED BY

190 SKS.G-50/50 POZ 2%GEL,5%SALT,5#/SK GILSONITE,.3%HALAD-344,.2%SUPER CBL

W/Rq 7.18 YEILD 1.23 LBS/GAL 14.4 DISPLACE 280 BBLS H20 BUMP PLUG 1418 PSI = 500 OVER
PLUG DID NOT HOLD . GOOD CIRC. THREW OUT CEMENT JOB.

13:30 22:30 9.oo WAIT ON CEMENT - HELD 800 PSI BACKPRESSURE
TRANSFER MUD - CLEAN MUDTANKS - SET OUT KELLY- SUBS - FOR INSPECTION

22:30 0:00 1.50 BLEED OFF PRESSURE - SET SLIPS g 175,000 - RUFF CUT CASING 12" ABOVE SLIPS

Daily Total



EngIneering &Supervise EXACTEngineering, Inc. (918) 599-9400

Operator: Wolverine G&OCo of Utah, LLC DAILYDRILLING REPORT 24 hm - midnight to midnight

DATE WELL
CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE API# SUPERVISOR

09/03/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 UnitRig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 NAYLOR-REBSOM

DAYSFI SPUD PRESENTOPERATIONS @MIDNIGHT TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH

26 LAYINGDOWNBHA. 7,158 0 0.00 #DIVl0! navajo 7170 md

MUUDAIA
WT VIS. WL CK PM SAND SOLIDS % PV YP GELS DEPTH DATEITIME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MBT SALT PPM

8.4 35 8.0 1/32 9.0 0.50 0.50 7 9 5/9 6923 9/2/0800 3,200 130 5,280

bli DAIA

BIT SIZE MFG. TYPE lADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd") IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULLCONDITION

NO. CODE or TFA
RT+MTR T B G

8 8.50 SEC EBXS30S 537 10686495 12 12 12 6361 6666 305 22.00 13.9 Y 30/120 40/45 8 E I

9 8.50 SEC ERA33 547 731186 14 14 14 6666 7156 492 22.50 21.9 Y 30/120 40/45 5 E I

RRE 8.50 SEC ERA33 547 731186 14 14 14 7158 7158 0 0.00 N 45 0 5 E I

HYDRAULICS
SLOWPUMP

PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE GAL/ STK SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MTR DIFF HHP / IN' ECD

NO. LENGTH
PRESS. PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 120 355
1 460

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96
2 400

3 National 6" 8.5 2.96
3

DRILL STRING
GEOLOGlC GENERAL INFO

BOTTOMHOLEASSEMBLY LENGTH D.D. i.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHOLOGY RIG INFO

TWIN CREEK 6,154 5,730 LS-100% Rig No Unit111

Navajo 6,465 6,032 Sand Cell Narren 918-645-6671

Last BOP Test 8/29
GAsuAIA

BOTTOMSUPTIME BGGAS CONNGAS TRIPGAs NuAlDOPTuol 9/29

Last Safety Meeting 9/3
MHotNs

GASUNIIS FROM IO ROP(FT/HR) Luet COF Daill 9/3

Last Operate Pipe Rar 9/3

Last Operate Blind Rat 9/3

: : : : :
Last Operate Annular 9/3

GTRINGWT. kHA WT. ÞUWT. 80 WT. A0Ï.TORQUE GRD. ELEVATION GL TO KB KB ELEVATION 1NTERMÊDIATECGG LASTCASING NEXT3AñiNG

32,000 55 34,000 28,000 90 5,839 17 5,856 9.625 9.625 @6350' 7

MD INCL AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+ / S- E+ / W- DLS TOOL MD INCL AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+ / S- E+ I W. DLS TOOL

MWD

DAILVAcilvily

FROM LAST24 HOURS:

o:oo I io:oo io.oo WIRE LINE LOGS-RUN #1=INDUCTION-#2=DENSITY NEUTRON-#3=MRIL-#4=DIPMETER

10:00 13:00 3.00 WORK BLINDRAMS - TRIP IN HOLE TO 7132'

13:oo 13:3o 0.50 WASH& REAM FROM 7132' TO 7158'

13:30 16:30 3.00 CIRC.COND MUD - RIG UP LAYDOWNMACHINE- PUMP PILL

16:30 0:00 7.50 LAYDOWN DRILLPIPE & BHA - BREAK KELLY

DailyTotal



Engineering &Supervis, EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) 599-9400

Operator: WolverineGaoCoofUtah,LLC DAILYDRILLING REPORT 24hrs-midnighttomidnight

DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE APE SUPERVISOR

09/02/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 DL Naylor

DAŸS FI SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ MlDNIGHT TOTALDEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH

25 Logging 7,158 0 0.00 #DIVIO! navajo 7170 md

MUbbAIA
WT VIS. WL CK PH SAND SOLIDS% PV YP GELS DEPTH DATE/TIME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MBT SALTPPM

8.4 35 8.0 1/32 9.0 0.50 0.50 7 9 5/9 6923 9/2/0800 3,200 130 5,280

911laAIA
BIT SIZE MFG. TYPE IADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd") IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULLCONDITION

NO. CODE or TFA
RT+MTR TTT

8 8.50 SEC EBXS30S 537 10686495 12 12 12 6361 6666 305 22.00 13.9 Y 30/120 40/45 8 E I

9 8.50 SEC ERA33 547 731186 14 14 14 6666 7158 492 22.50 21.9 Y 30/120 40/45 5 E )

HYDRAULIGS SLOWPUMP

PUMP MANUFACTURER UNER STROKE GALI STK SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MTR DIFF HHP I IN' ECD

No. LENGTM PRESS. PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 120 355 1 460

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 2 400

3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 3

DRILL STRING I GEOLOGIC GENERALINFO

BOTTOMHOLEASSEMBLY LENGTH O.D. I.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHOLOGY RIG INFO

BIT 1.00 19-5"HSW 576.380 TWINCREEK 6,154 5,730 LS-100% Rig No Unit 111

MOTOR 20.37 JARS 32.630 Navajo 6,465 6,032 Sand Cell Norren 918-645-6671

FLOAT 2.63 4-5"HWDP 119.220 Last BOP Test 8/29
GAsbAIA

UBHO-SUB 2.60 BOTTOMSUPTIME BGGAS CONNGAS TRIPGAs NeAlDOPTeal 9/29

6 1/2 MONEL 31.04 Last Safety Meeting 9/2
silo s

XO-SUB 1.90 GAS UNITS FROM TO ROP (FTlHR) Last BOF Drill 8/30

Last Operate Pipe Rar 8/29

Last Operate Blind Rat 9/2

BHA.= 787.78 : : : : :-:
.

:-. : : : : : : : ; Last Operate Annular 8/29

ŠTRING WT. BHAWT. PU WT. SO WT. ROT. TORQUE GRD. ELEVATION GL TO KB KB ELEVATION INTERMEDIATECSG LAST CASING NEXT ASING

175 55 245 140 140 5,839 17 5,856 9.625 9.625 @6350' 7

bUMLvb
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+IS- E+/W- DLS TOOL MD INCL AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+/S- E+IW- DLS TOOL

6,924 10.40 232.70 6484 2129 -1623 -1377 0.70 MWD MWD

7,113 10.50 239.40 6670 2161 -1642 -1405 0.67 MWD

DAILVAclMly
FROM LAST24 HOURS:

0:00 22:00 22.00 REPAIR LOGGING TRUCK
22:00 0:00 2.00 LOGGING

f3milv Total 24



Engineering & Supervis.. EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) 599-9400

Operator: WolverineG&OcoofUtah,LLC DAILYDRILLING REPORT 24hrs-midnighttomidnight

DATE WELL
CONTRACTOR COUNTY,STATE SPUD DATE APW SUPERVISOR

09/01/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 DL Naylor

DÃYSFI SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ MIDNIGHT TOTALDEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH

24 Logging 7,158 417 16.00 26.1 navajo 7170 md

MUbDAIA

WT VIS. WL CK PH SAND SOLIDS % PV YP GELS DEPTH DATE/TIME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MBT SALT PPM

8.4 35 8.0 1/32 9.0 0.50 0.50 7 9 5/9 6923 9/1/0800 3,200 130 5,280

Bil DAIA

IÍÍÏ SIZE MFG. TYPE lADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd") IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR APM WOB DULLCONDITION

NO. CODE or TFA
RT+MTR T B G

8 8.50 SEC EBXS30S 537 10686495 12 12 12 6361 6666 305 22.00 13.9 Y 30/120 40/45 8 E I

9 8.50 SEC ERA33 547 731186 14 14 14 6666 7158 492 22.50 21.9 Y 30/120 40/45

HybRAULics
SLOWÞUMP

PUMP MANUFACTURER UNER STROKE GALI STK SPM GPM AVDP AV DC PUMP MTR DIFF HHP / IN' ECD

No. LENGTH
PRESS. PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 120 355
1 460

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96
2 400

3 National 6" 8.5 2.96
3

¯ ¯ DRILLSTRING
GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO

BOTTOMHOLEASSEMBLY LENGTH O.D. LD. FORMATION MD TVD UTHOLOGY l RIG INFO

BIT 1.00 19-5"HSW 576.380 TWINCREEK 6,154 5,730 LS-100% Rig No Unit111

MOTOR 20.37 JARS 32.630 Navajo 6,465 6,032 Sand Cell Norren 918-645-6671

FLOAT 2.63 4-5"HWDP 119.220
Last BOP Test 8/29

GASDAIA

UBHO-SUB 2.60 BOTTOMS UP TIME BG GAS CONN GAS TRIP GAS ÑUAEBÛP TubÊ 9/29

6 1/2 MONEL 31.04
Last Safety Meeting 8/30

sWuWs
XO-SUB 1.90 GASUNIIS FROM 10 NOP(F1/HR) Luul BOF Diill 8/30

Last Operate Pipe Rar 8/29

Last Operate Blind Rat 8/29

BHA.=787.78 : : . : : : : : : : :
Last Operate Annular 8/29

STRING WT. BHAWT. PU WT. SO WT. ROT. TOROUE GRD, ELEVATION GLTO KB KB ELEVATION JNTERMEDIATECSG LAST CASING NEXT :ASING

175 55 245 140 140 5,839 17 5,856 9.625 9.625 @6350' 7

MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+/S- E+IW DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+/S- E+/W- DLS TOOL

6,924 10.40 232.70 6484 2129 -1623 -1377 0.70 MWD
MWD

7,113 10.50 239.40 6670 2161 -1642
-1405 0.67 MWD

bAILY AcIivltv
FROM LAST24 HOURS:

0:00 16:00
,

16.00 Drill&survey 6741 to 7158

16:00 16:30 0.50 Rig service
16:30 18:00 1.50 Circulate & condition for logs

18:00 22:00 4.oo POOH for logs
22:00 23:00 1.oo LD directional tools
23:00 0:00 1.00 Logging run # 1 HRI

This am. Logging truckbroke down with tools g 5700' in cased hole

Dailv Total



EngIneerIng &Supervist EXACTEngineering, Inc. (918) 599-9400

Operator: Wolverine G&OCo of Utah, LLC DAILYDRILLINGREPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight

DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY,STATE SPUD DATE APW SUPERVISOR

08/31/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 UnitRig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 DL Naylor

DAYS F/ SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ MIDNIGHT TOTALDEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH

23 DRILLING 6,741 166 15.50 10.7 navajo 7170 md

MUbbAIA
WT VIS. WL CK PH SAND SOLIDS% PV YP GELS DEPTH DATE/TIME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MBT SALTPPM

8.5 36 7.0 1/32 9.5 0.50 1.20 7 11 6/10 6656 8/31/0800 2,700 120 4,455

bli DAIA
BIT SIZE MFG. TYPE lADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd") IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULLCONDITION

NO. CODE or TFA
RT+MTR

8 8.50 SEC EBXS30S 537 10686495 12 12 12 6361 6666 305 22.00 13.9 Y 30/120 40/45 8 E I

9 8.50 SEC ERA33 547 731186 14 14 14 6666 75 6.50 11.5

I
HYDRAULICS 1 SLOW PUMP

PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE GALI STK SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MTR DIFF HHP I IN' ECD

NO. LENGTM PRESS. PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 120 355 1 460

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 2 400

3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 3

DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO

BOTTOMHOLEASSEMBLY LENGTH O.D. I.D. FORMATION MD TVD UTHOLOGY RIG INFO

BIT 1.00 19-5"HSW 576.380 TWIN CREEK 6,154 5,730 LS-100% Rig No Unit 111

MOTOR 20.37 JARS 32.630 Cell Norren 918-645-6671

FLOAT 2.63 4-5"HWDP 119.220 Last BOP Test 8/29
GAsbAIA

UBHO-SUB 2.60 BOTTOMSUPTIME BGGAS CONNGAS TRIPGAS ÑUAi T bi 9/29

6 1/2 MONEL 31.04 Last Safety Meeting 8/30
sWoWs

XO-SUB 1.90 GAS UNITS FROM TO ROP(FTiHR) Laat BCP Dúll 8/30

Last Operate Pipe Rar 8/29

Last Operate Blind Rat 8/29

BHA.=787.78 : : : : : : : : . : : :-: :-: : : Last Operate Annular 8/29

STRINGWT. BHAWT. PUWT. So WT. ROT. TOROUE GRD. ELEVATION GL TO KB KB ELEVATION INTERMEDIATECSG LAST CASING NEXT 3ASING

175 55 245 140 140 5,839 17 5,856 9.625 9.625 @6350' 7

SUkvbyb
MD INCL AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+ I S- E+ I W- DLS TOOL MD INCL AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+ I S- E+ I W- DLS TOOL

6,639 10.40 212.90 6204 2077 -1585 -1343 0.70 MWD MWD

6,733 10.50 213.90 6296 2094 -1599 -1352 0.22 MWD

DAILYACTMtv
FROM LAST 24 HOURS:

o:oo 9:oo 9.00 Drill&survey 6575 to 6666
9:00 13:30 4.50 POOH change bit
13:30 17:30 4.00 TIH
17:30 0:00 6.50 Drill&survey 6666 to 6741

COF9mAl
This am 6865

DailyTotal



Engineering &Supervise EXACTEngineering, Inc. (918) 599-9400

Operator: Wolverine G&OCo of utah,LLC DAILYDRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnightto midnight

DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE APW SUPERVISOR

08/30/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 George Urban

DAYSFI SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @ MIDNIGHT TOTALDEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH

22 DRILLING 6,575 214 13.00 16.5 Arapian 7170 md

MUDDAIA

WT VIS. WL CK PH SAND SOLIDS% PV YP GELS DEPTH DATE/TIME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MBT SALTPPM

8.4 38 NC 1/32 10.5 0.00 0.25 5 9 5/7 6361 8/30/0800 2,700 120 4,455

BIIDAIA

BIT SIZE MFG. TYPE IADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1/32nd") IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM Wos DULLCONDITION

NO. CODE or TFA
RT+MTR

8 8.50 SEC EBXS30S 537 10686495 12 12 12 6361 214 13.00 16.5 Y 30/120 40/45

#DIVIO!

HYDRAULICS
SLOW PUMP

PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE GAL / STK SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MTR DIFF HHP / IN ECD

NO. LENGTH
PRESS. PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 120 355 1 460

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96
2 400

3 National 6" 8.5 2.96
3

DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC I GENERAL INFO

BOTTOMHOLEASSEMBLY LENGTH O.D. I.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHOLOGY RIG INFO

BIT 1.00 19-5"HSW 576.380 TWIN CREEK 6,154 5,730 LS-100% Rig No Unit 111

MOTOR 20.37 JARS 32.630
Cell Norren 918-645-6671

FLOAT 2.63 4-5"HWDP 119.220 Last BOP Test 8/29
GASUAIA

UBHO-SUB 2.60 BOTTOMSUPTIME BGGAS CONNGAS TRJPGAS Nexl BOP Teal 9/29

6 1/2 MONEL 31.04
Last Safety Meeting 8/30

840 s
XO-SUB 1.90 GASUNITS FROM IO ROP(FT/HR) Lust BOP Diill 8/30

Last Operate Pipe Rar 8/29

Last Operate Blind Rai 8/29

BHA.= 787.78 . . : : : : : . : : : :
Last Operate Annular 8/29

¯3TAINGWT. BHAWT. PUWT. 80 WT. ROÏ.TOROUE GRD. ELEVATION GL TO KB KB ELEVATION INTERMEDIATECSG LAs? CA$lNG NEXT:A$lNG

175 55 245 140 140 5,839 17 5,856 9.625 9.625 @ 6350' 7

MD INCL AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+/S- E+/W- DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+IS- E+/W- DLS TOOL

6,450 11.60 214.10 6018 2041 -1554 -1323 0.38 MWD
MWD

6,513 11.20 211.10 6080 2054 -1565
-1330 1.14 MWD

DAILYAcilvliv
FROM LAST24 HOURS:

o:oo I 1:so 1.50 WOC TEST BOPE
1:30 2:30 1.00 PK/UP BHA 8 1/2" BIT MUD MOTOR AND MONEL

2:30 3:00 0.50 KELLYUP TEST MWD AND MOTOR ALLGOOD.

3:oo 5:oo 2.oo SLIP & CUT DRLG. LINE
5:00 9:00 4.00 TIH
9:00 11:00 2.00 PKlUP 6 JTS. DP TAG CEMENT AND DRILLFLOAT COLLAR AND SHOE.

11:00 0:00 13.00 DRILL8 1/2" HOLE FROM 6361' TO 6575'

THIS AM6645

Daily Total



Engineering & Supervision EXACT Engineering, Inc. (sis) sos-94oo

Operator: Wolverine G&OCo of Utah, LLC DAILY DRILLINGREPORT 24 hrs - midnight to midnight

DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY,STATE SPUD DATE API# SUPERVISOR

08/29/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 George Urban

DAYS FI SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS@MIDNIGHT TCTALDEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH

21 pklup directional tools 6,361 #VALUE! Arapian 7170 md

MUbDAIA
WT VIS. WL CK PH SAND SOLIDS% PV YP GELS DEPTH DATE/TIME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MBT SALTPPM

10.4 31 NC 2/32 6.8 0.50 5.20 5 6 4/9 6361 8/29/0800 162,000 3280 267,300

bil LAIA
BIT SIZE MFG TYPE IADC SERIAL NO. JETS (il32nt) IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULL CONDITION

No. CODE or TFA
RT+MTR T

6 12.25 REED HP53A 537 PB4408 24 24 24 4027 5917 1890 75.50 25.0 Y 30/140 40/45 4 3 IN

7/5 12.25 REED RR-HPS3A 537 PB4407 24 24 24 5917 6361 444 23.00 19.3 Y 30/140 45 3 3 -1/16

8 8.50 SEC EBXS30S 537 10686495 12 12 12 6361 Y

HYDRAULICS SLÓW PUMP

PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE GAL / STK SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MTRDIFF HHP / IN2 ECD

NO. LENGTH PRESS. PRESS

1 National 6" 8.5 2,96 115 340 1

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 340 2

3 National 6" 8.5 2.96
3

DRILLSTRING I GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO

BOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY LENGTH O.D. LD. FORMATION MD TVD LITHOLOGY RIG INFO

BIT 1.00 19-5"HSW 576.380 TWIN CREEK 6,154 5,730 LS-100% Rig No Unit 111

MOTOR 20.37 JARS 32.630 Cell Narren 918-646-6671

FLOAT 2.63 4-5"HWDP 119.220 Last BOP Test 8/29
GAsbAIA

UBHO-SUB 2.60 BOTTOMSUPTIME BG GAS CONNGAS TRJPCAS Next BOF Teal 9/29

6 1/2 MONEL 31.04
Last Safety Meeting 8/29

XO-SUB 1.90 GAS UNITS FROM 10 ROP(FT]HR) Lam bOP Diill 8/29

Last Operate Pipe Rar 8/29

Last Operate Blind Ra 8/29

BHA.=787.78 : : : : : : : : :
Last Operate Annular 8/29

STRINGWr. BHA WL PU WT. SO WT. ROT TORQUE GRD. ELEVATION GL TO KB KBELEVATION INTERMEDIATECSC LASTCASING NEXT3ASING

17 5,856 13.375 @ 2440 9.625

sUkukys
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+ I S- E+ I W- DLS TOOL MO INCL AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+ I S- E+/ W- DLS TOOL

MWD MWD

MWD

LAILVAchvity
raoM LAST24 HOURS:

o:oo 9:00 9.00 FINISH RUNNING9 5/8 47LB. P110 CASING
9:00 9:30 0.50 PKlUP LANDINGJT. LAND CASING@6350'

9:ao io:so 1.oo RIG DOWN FRANKSCASINGCREW.
10:30 12:30 2.00 HSMWITH HALLIBURTON CEMENTERS, TEST LINES TO 1500PSI AND CEMENT.

12:30 13:00 0.50 RIG DOWN HALLIBURTON CEMENTERS.
LAND PLUGg 12:08 500 PSI OVER g 1300 PSI.

la:oo o:oo 11.oo WOC CLEANMUD TANKS

THIS AMTlH Wl8 1/2" BIT

DailyTotal 24.00
cual DAIA

AFE DNC $ DAILYMUD $ 1,235 DAILYDRYHOLE COST $



F(xm 3160-5 UNITEDSTATES FORMAPPROVED

(April2004) DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR Ep
11,007

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeaseSerialNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTE ""*

Do not use thIs form for proposals to drlII or to re-enter an 6. If Indian,AllotteeorTribeName

abandoned well. Use Form 3160 - 3 (APD) for such proposals• N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Otherinstructions ori reverse side. 7. IfUnitorCA/Agreement,Nameand/orNo.

Wolverine Fed Exploration Unit

1. Type of SilWell Gu Well Other 8. WellNameand No.
' I L wolverineFederal #20-1

2. NameofOperatorWolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC 9. API WellNo.

3a Address 3b. PhoneNo. (include area code) 4304130032

One Riverfront Plaza, 55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI 616-458-1150 10.Fieldand Pool, or ExploratoryArea

4. LocationofWell(Footage,Sec.,T, R.,M, or Survy Description) Covenant Field

Surface hole location ' FSL & FWL, SE/SW, Section 17, T23S, RlW
11. CountyorParish, State

Bottom hole location - 660' FNL & 660' FEL, NWINW, Section 20, T23S, R1W Sevier Co, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TOINDICATENATURE OF NGTÏCE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

O Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) WaterShut-Of

Notice of Intent AlterCasing FmetureTreat Reclamation Well Integrity

SubsequentRepott Casing Repair NewConstruction Recomplete Other suspend operations

ChangePlans Plugand Abandon TemporarilyAbandon

O FinalAbandonmentNotice ConvetttoInjection PlugBack WaterDisposal

13. DescribeProposedorCompletedOpemtion(clearlystate all pertinentdetails,includingestimated startingdateof any proposedwork andapproximate durationthereof.

Iftheproposalis todeependirectionallyor recompletehorizontally,givesubsurfacelocationsandmeasuredand truevertical depthsof all pertinentmarkers and zones.

AttachtheBondunder which thework will beperformedor providetheBondNo. onfilewith BLM/BIA.Requiredsubsequent reports shall be filedwithin30days

followingcompletion of theinvolvedoperations. If theoperationæsults ina multiplecompletionor recompletion ina new interval,a Form31604 shallbefiledonce

testinghasbeencompleted.FinalAbandonmentNoticesshall be filedonly after all requirements, includingreclamation, havebeencompleted, and the operator has

determinedthatthesiteis leady forfinalinspection.)

Production casing was set September 4, 2005, and drilling operations are completed.

Further operations on the subject well have been temporarily suspended until additional wells can be drilled from this pad Bl.

It is estimated that completion operations will begin approximately November 1, 2005, or as soon thereafter as a completion rig

rig becomes available.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

=ederal ApprovalOfThisOil, Gas and Mining Actionis Necessarv
Date: '' /Di

xc: UDOGM

14. Ihereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

George C. N y Title Engineering Technician - EXACT Engineering Inc

Signatur Date 09/12/2005

T IS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

gigoyed _

Title Date

Conditionsof approval,ifany, are attached. Approvalof thisnoticedoesnot warrant or

certifythattheapplicantholdslegalor equitabletitleto thoserights in thesubject lease Office
which would entitle theapplicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18U.S.C.Section1001and Title43 U.S.C.Section1212,makeit a crime foranypersonknowinglyand willfully tomaketo any departmentor agency ofthe United

Statesanyfalse,fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representations asto anymatterwithin itsjurisdiction.

(Instructionson page



EBOTEngineering,Inc. WWELOXSCt0MiliB0flDU.COMI

415 S. Boston Ave., Suite 734, Tulsa, OK 74103 • (918) 599-9400 • (918) 599-9401 (fax)

Steven R. Hash, P.E.
Registered Professional Engineer
stevehash@exactengineering.com

CONFIDENTIAL PLEASE!

August 22, 2005

Mr. Dustin Doucet
Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Re: Wolverine Federal 20-1 well
Sec 17 T23S RO1W
Sevier Co., UT
APl# 43-041-30032

Dear Mr. Doucet,

On behalf ofWolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC, please find enclosed daily drilling reports for the
subject wellfrom August 14, 2005 throughAugust 21, 2005. Our depth is 4027 and we are presently waiting on

fishing toolsto recover part of a mud motor. We respectfullyrequest that the enclosed information remain

confidential.

Very Truly Yours,

Chris Nicely
Engineering Technician

Enclosures

copy without enclosures via email to:
Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah, LLC: Helene Bardolph RECEIVED
EXACT Engineering, Inc. well file ¡ JW 25 2005

DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINING

PetroleuntEngineeringConsulting,Personnela jobsite Supervision
complete well design, construction & management, drilling, completion, production, pipelines, appraisals,

due diligence, acquisitions, procedures, temporary personnel and fiefd



Engineering &Supervision EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) sos-94oo
Operator: WolverineGaocoofutah,LLc aAILY DRILLING REPORT 24hrs-midnighttomidnight

DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE APl# SUPERVISOR

08/21/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 UnitRig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 George Urban
DAYSFI SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS@MIDNIGHT TOTAL DE PTH PROGRESS DRILLING T1ME ROP FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH

13 WAIT ON FISHINGTOOLS 4,027 268 10.50 25.5 Arapian 7170 md

MUbbAIA
WT VIS WL CK PH SAND SOLIDS% PV YP GELS DEPTH DATEITIME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MBT SALTPPM

9.9 30 NC 2/32 8.8 0.50 5.50 4 11 6/11 3959 8/21/0800 108,000 3160 178,200

bli DAIA
BIT SIZE MFG. TYPE IADC SERIAL NO JETS (1/32ncr) IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULL CONDITION

NO. CODE or TFA RT+MTR T B G

4 12.25 REED EHP-53A 537 5767 24 24 24 2709 3618 909 39.00 23.3 Y 30+13 35-40 6 2 -1/8

5 12.25 REED HPS3A 537 PB4407 24 24 24 3618 409 16.00 25.6 Y 30/140 35-40

HYDRAULIÒŠ ŠLÓW AUMP
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE GAL/ ST SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MTR DIFF HHP I IN2 Eco 67 sm 76 sm 100 sm

NO. LENGTH PRESS PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 1450 225 1 180

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 2 220

3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 3

DRILLSTRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO
BOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY LENGTH OD I D FORMATION MD TVD LITHOLOGY R1G INFO

BIT 1.50 12.250 Rig No Unit 111

MOTOR 23.10 X-OVER 2.870 Cell Ncrren 918-645-6671

UBHO 3.25 3-5/8"HSW 150.880 Last BOP Test 8/17
GAsbAIA

MONEL 31.10 X-OVER 2.460 BorroMsupTIME sooAs coNNGAS TRIPGAs NexlBOPTesl 9/17

PONY MONEL 10.08 19-5"HSW 576.380 Last Safety Meeting 8/21
SHOWS

SHOCK SUB. 11.80 JARS ö2.630 GAS UNITS FROM TO ROP(FT/HR) Lal BOF Dii!I 8/21
3-5"HWDP 89.280 Last Operate Pipe Rat 8/21

Last Operate BlindRa 8/21

BHA.= 960.23 : : : : : : Last Operate Annular 8/21
STRINÒWT BHA WT PU WT SO WT ROT TORQUE GRD. ELEVATION GL TO KB KBELEVATION INTERMEDIATËCSO LASTCASING NÉXÌ3ASING

120 58,000 133 102 235 5,839 17 5,856 13.375 @ 244C 9.625

sURV6vs
MD INCL AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+/S- E+/W- DLS TOOL MD INCL AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+IS- E+/W- DLS TOOL

3,793 23.60 218.50 3598 975 -733 -644 3.17 MWD 3,982 25.70 214.30 3769 1055 -797 -691 0.81 MWD
3,888 25.50 216.00 3684 1014 -764 -668 2.28 MWD MWD

DAILY AeIMI y
FROM LAST24 HOURS:

o:oo 10:30 10.50 DRILL ROTATE & SLIDE FROM 3759' TO 4027'
10:30 11:oo o.so BLEW STANDPIPE OUT OF VALVE, SET KELLY BACK, PULL 1 STAND
11:00 11:30 0.50 WORK ON STAND PIPE, WASHED OUT THREADSON TOP OF STANDPIPE VALVE.
11:30 12:30 1.00 PULL 18 STANDS TO SHOE RECElVED
12:30 16:30 4.00 WELD AND REPAIR STANDPIPE, INSTALL NEW VALVEAND 4' OF 4" PIPE.
16:30 17:30 1.00 TIH SEP
17:30 18:00 0.50 KELLYUP PRESSURED UP OFF BOTTOM, MOTOR OR BIT PLUGGED.
18:00 20:30 2.50 POOH
20:30 21:oo o.So MUD MOTOR PARTED 10' UP FROM BIT LEAVINGBIT AND 10' OF MOTOR IN HOLE AV ULMS&MINING
21:00 22:00 1.00 LAY DOWN MONELS AND MWD.
22:00 0:00 2.00 WAIT ON FISHING TOOLS.

THIS AM PKlUP FISHING



Engineering &Supervision EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) sos-94oo

Operator: Wolverine GSO Co of Utah, LLC aAILY DRILLING REPORT 24 hrs - midnightto midnight

DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY,STATE SPUD DATE API# SUPERVISOR

08/20/05 WolverineFederal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 G.Urban IR. Rebsom

OAYS FI SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS@MIDNIGHT TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH

12 DRILLING 3,397 588 23.50 25.0 Arapian 7170 md

MUbbAIA
WT VIS. WL CK PH SAND SOLIDS% PV YP GELS DEPTH DATEITIME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MBT SALTPPM

9.7 30 NC 2/32 9.0 0.50 4.75 4 7 4/7 3554 8/20/0800 84,000 1840 138,600

bil DAIA
BIT SIZE MFG. TYPE IADC SERALNO, JETS(1/32ncr) IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULLCONDITION

NO. CODE or TFA
RT+MTR T B G

4 12.25 REED EHP-53A 537 5767 24 24 24 2709 3618 909 39.00 23.3 Y 30+132 35-40 6 2 -1/8

5 12.25 REED HPS3A 537 PB4407 24 24 24 3618 #VALUE! Y 30/140 35-40 6 2 -1/8

HYDRAULlÓŠ ŠLÒW PUMP

PUMP MANUFACTURER L1NER STROKE GALI STV SPM GPM AV DP AVDC PUMP MTR DIFF HHP I IN2 ECD m

NO. LENGTH PRESS. PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 1450 225 1 180

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 2 220

3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 3 375

DRILLSTRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO

BOTTOMHOLEASSEMBLY LENGTH O.D l.D. FORMATlON MD TVD UTHOLOGY RIG INFO

BIT 1.50 12.250 Rig No Unit 111

MOTOR 23.10 X-OVER 2.870 Cell Ncrren 918-645-6671

UBHO 3.25 3-5/8"HSW 150.880 Last BOP Test 8/17
GAsl]AiA

MONEL 31.10 X-OVER 2..4ÔÜBOTIOMSUP UME BGGAS CONNGAS IRINGAs Nexl BOF Teal 9/17

PONY MONEL 10.08 19-5"HSW 576.380 Last Safety Meeting 8/20
SHUAN

SHOCKSUB. 11.80 JARS 32.0 û GASUNUS EROM 10 NOP(FT/HR) L.n.lBOFDiill 8/20

3-5"HWDP 89.280 Last Operate Pipe Ra. 8/20

Last Operate BlindRa 8/20

BHA.=960.23 -:- -:.: -: :
Last Operate Annular 8/20

STRINGWT. BHAWT. PU WÍ. SO WT. ROT TOROUE GRD. ELEVAT10N GL TO KB KB ELEVATION INTERMEDiATECSG LA$TCASING NEXÌ3ASING

120 58,000 133 102 235 5,839 17 5,856 13.375 @244C 9.625

sUkv6vs
MD 1NCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+ / S- E+ / W- DLS TOOL MD INCL AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+ / S- E+ IW- DLS TOOL

3,131 26.50 215.70 3013 666 -486 -457 1.28 MWD 3,320 30.40 219.40 3179 757 -558 -513 1.21 MWD

3,226 29.50 218.00 3097 711 -521 -484 3.36 MWD 3,415 28.80 217.10 3261 804 -595 -542 2.07 MWD

DAILY AcIMI v
FROM LAST24 HOURS

0:00 11:oo 11.00 DRILL ROTATE & SLIDE FROM 339T TO 3618'

11:oo 11:30 0.50 CIRC. PUMP PILL FOR DRY JOB

11:30 13:30 2.00 POOH
13:30 16:00 2.50 LYlDN BIT AND MOTOR UP SAME SERVICE TEST OK. RIG SERVICE.

16:00 18:00 2.00 TIH RFCFIV iD
SEP25 2105

UlkUr UIL,UAbe



Engineering &Supervision EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) 599-9400

Operator: WolverineGaocoofutah,LLC »AILY DRILLING REPORT 24nrs-midnighttomidnight
DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE API# SUPERVISOR

08/19/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 Rodger Rebsom
DAYSFISPUD PRESENT OWERATIONS@MIDNIGHT TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMATION AUTH DEPÌH

11 DRILLING 3,397 588 23.50 25.0 Arapian 7170 md
MUbbAIA

WT VIS WL CK PH SAND SOLIDS% PV YP GELS DEPTH DATE/TIME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MBT SALTPPM

9.3 31 NC 2/32 11.5 TR 3.50 3 7 4/7 2987 8/19/0800 58,000 840 95,700

bil DAIA
BIT SIZE MFG. TYPE IADC SERALNO. JETSDI32ncr) 1N OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOS DULLCONDITION
NO CODE orTFA RT+MTR T B G

#DIVl0!
4 12.250 REED EHP-53A 5767 24 24 24 2709 688 28.00 24.6 Y 30+13 35-40

#DIVl0I

#DIVIO!

HYDRAULIÒ$ GLÔWPUMP
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE GALIST SPM GPM AVDP AVDC PUMP MTRDIFF HHP/INa ECD 67s m 76s m 100s m

NO. LENGTH PRESS. PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 1450 225 1 180

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 2 220
3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 3 375

DRILLSTRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO
BOTTOMHOLEASSEMBLY LENGTH O.D I D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHOLOGY RIG INFO

BIT 1.50 12.250 Rig No Unit 111
MOTOR 23.10 X-OVER 2.870 Cell Ncrren 918-645-6671

UBHO 3.25 3-5/8"HSW 150.880 Last BOP Test 8/17
GAsbAiAMONEL 31.10 X-OVER 2.4ô G BOTTOMSUP TIME BGGAS CONNGAS TRlP GAS Nexl BOF Test 9/17

PONY MONEL 10.08 19-5"HSW 576.380 Last Safety Meeting 8/17
SHoWS

SHOCKSUB. 11.80 JARS 32.030 GASUNITS FROM TO ROP(FT/HR) La tBOFDrill 8/18
3-S"HWDP 89.280 Last Operate Pipe Rat 8/17

Last Operate BlindRa 8/17
BHA.=960.23 .: :.: :-:- : : :.:-: Last Operate Annular 8/17

STRING WT. BHA WT. PU WT SO WT ROT. TOROUE GRD. ELEVATION GL TO KB KB ELEVATION INTERMEDlATE CSG LAST CASING WEXT JASING

120 58,000 133 102 235 5,839 17 5,856 13.375 @ 244C 9.625

kUkvbys
MD INCL AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+/S- E+/W- DLS TOOL MD lNCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+/S- E+/W- DLS TOOL

3,131 26.50 215.70 3013 666 -486 -457 1.28 MWD 3,320 30.40 219.40 3179 757 -558 -513 1.21 MWD
3,226 29.50 218.00 3097 711 -521 -484 3.36 MWD 3,415 28.80 217.10 3261 804 -595 -542 2.07 MWD

DAILY Aullbily
FROM LAST 24 HOURS

0:00 14:30 14.50 DRILL FROM 2809' TO 3176'
14:30 15:00 0.50 SERVICE RIG - WORK PIPE RAMS
15:00 0:00 9.00 DRILL FROM 3176' TO 3397'

DECEIVED
SEP25 2UUb

fW PG DIL,GM'&



Engineering & Supervision EXACT Engineering, InC. (918) 599-9400

Operator: Wolverine Gao co of Utah, LLC -AILY DRILLING REPORT 29 nrs - midnightto midnight
DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY STATE SPUD DATE API# SUPERVISOR

08/18/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 Rodger Rebsom
DAYSFI SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @MIONIGHT TOTALDEPTH PROGREJS DR1LLING TIME ROP FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH

10 DRILLING 2,809 369 16.00 23.1 Arapian 7170 md
MUbDAIA

WT VIS. WL CK PH SAND SOLIDS% PV YP GELS DEPTH DATETTIME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MBT SALTPPM

8.6 29 NC 1/32 9.0 0.00 1.90 3 5 1 2580 8/18/0800 36,000 640 36,000

bli DAIA
BIT SIZE MFG. TYPE IADC SERIALNO. JETS (1/32ncr) 1N OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULLCONDITION
NO CODE orTFA RT+MTR T B G

3 12.250 REED EHP-43H C41086 24 24 24 2440 2709 269 #DIVIO! Y 30+13 35 6 2 I
4 12.250 REED EHP-53A 5767 24 24 24 2709 100 4.50 22.2 Y 30+13 35-40

#DIV/0!

#DIVIO!

HYDRAULIÓ$ ŠLÒW PUMP
PUMP MANUFACTURER UNER STROKE GAL I ST SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MTR OIFF HHP I IN2 ECD 67 sm 76 sm 100 sm

NO. LENGTH PRESS PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 1450 225 1
2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 115 2
3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 3

DRILLSTRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO
BOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY LENGTH O.D. I D FORMATION MD TVD LITHOLOGY RIGINFO

BIT 1.50 12.250 Rig No Unit 111
MOTOR 23.10 X-OVER 2.870 Cell Ncrren 918-645-6671

UBHO 3.25 3-5/8"HSW 150.880 Last BOP Test 8/17
GASDAIAMONEL 31.10 X-OVER 2.400 BOTTOMSUPTIME BGGAS CONNGAS TRIPGAs NexlBOPTesl 9/17

PONY MONEL 10.08 19-5"HSW 576.380 Last Safety Meeting 8/17
SHoWsSHOCK SUB. 11.80 JARS 32.000 GASUNilS FRUM 10 HOP(El/HH) Laat DOF Diill 8/18

3-5"HWDP 89.280 Last Operate Pipe Rat 8/17

Last Operate BlindRa 8/17
BHA.=960.23 11.80 :-:.: :-:-:-:-: Last Operate Annular 8/17

STRING WT BHAWT. PU WT. SO WT ROT TORQUE GRD ELEVATION GL TO KB KBELEVATION INTERMEDIATECSG LAS1CASING NEXT LAalNÒ
110,000 58,000 120,000 90,000 205 5,839 17 5,856 13.375 @244C 9.625

sUkvkvs
MD INCL AZIMUTH TVD SECTIO N+/S- E+/W- DLS TOOL MD INCL AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+/S- E+/W- DLS TOOL

2,459 22.40 235.40 2411 371 -270 -255 1.16 MWD 2,659 24.30 226.80 2595 448 -321 -316 1.24 MWD
2,565 23.50 228.90 2508 411 -295 -287 2.60 MWD 2,754 27.10 226.60 2680 489 -349 -346 2.95 MWD

bAILYAcIMlv
FROM LAST 24 HOURS

0:00 0:30 o.5o FINISH TRIP IN
c:3o 1:30 1.00 TAGCEMENT g 2390' - DRILL CEMENT - FLOAT - SHOE.
1:30 13:00 11.So DRILL - SLIDE FROM 2440' TO 2709'
13:00 15:00 2.00 TRIP OUT - FORMATION CHANGE - SUCKED 3 BUTTONS OUT - BROKE 9 BUTTONS OFF
15:00 16:00 1.00 WORK BLIND RAMS - SERVICE RIG - CHANGE BIT - TEST MOTOR & MWD - OK
16:00 18:30 2.50 TRIP IN
18:30 19:oo 0.50 WORK & PUSH JUNK ASIDE CLEAN BOTTOM RECElVED19:00 20:30 1.50 DRILL FROM 2709' TO 2740'
20:30 21:00 0.50 WORK & PUSH JUNK ASIDE CLEAN BOTTOM
21:00 0:00 3.00 DRILL FROM 2740' TO 2809' ÛÛ$

DIV.UEUIL,GAS&



Engineering & Supervision EXACT Engineering, Inc. (sis) ses-94oo
Operator: WolverineGaoCoofutah,LLC »AIL.YDRILLING REPORT 24nrs-midnighttomidnight
DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY,STATE SPUD DATE API# SUPERVISOR

08/17/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 UnitRig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 Rodger Rebsom
DAYSFI SPUD PRESENTOPERAT10ÑSg MtDNIGHT TOTALDEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMATION ÁUTH DEPTH

9 TRIP IN 2,440 0 0.00 #DIV/0! Arapian 7170 md
MUbbAIA

WT VIS WL CK PH SAND SOLIDS% PV YP GELS DEPTH DATEITIME CHLORIDES CALClUM MBT SALTPPM

8.6 26 NC 0 9.0 0.00 0.00 0 0 0 2440 8/17-0800 36,000 640 36,000

bil DAIA
BIT SIZE MFG. TYPE IADC SERIAL NO. JETS (1fl2nd") IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULL CONDITION
NO. CODE orTFA RT+MTR T 8 G

3 12.250 REED EHP-43H C41086 24 24 24 2440 #DIVIO! Y

#DIVIO!

#DIVl0!
#DIVIO!

HYDRAULICá GLÔWPUMP
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE GAL I ST SPM GPM AVDP AVDC PUMP MTR DlFF HHP / IN2 ECD 67 sm 76 sm 100 sm
NO. LENGTH PRESS. PRESS

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 1
2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 2
3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 3

DRILLSTRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO
BOTTOMHOLEASSEMBLY LENGTH OD 1D. FORMATION MD TVO LITHOLOGY RIG INFO

BIT 1.50 12.250 SURFACE Rig No Unit 111
MOTOR 23.10 X-OVER 2.870 Cell Ncrren 918-645-6671

UBHO 3.25 3-5/8"HSW 150.880 Last BOP Test 8/17
GASUAIAMONEL 31.10 X-OVER 2.400 BOTTOMSUPTIME BGGAS CONNGAS TRIPGAS NexlBOFTest 9/17

PONY MONEL 10.08 19-5"HSW 576.380 Last Safety Meeting 8/17
SHoWSSHOCKSUB. 11.80 JARS 32.030 GASUNUS ENOM TO NOV(FI/HN) LolDOFDiill 8/18

3-5"HWDP 89.280 Last Operate Pipe Rat 8/17

Last Operate BlindRa 8/17
BHA.=960.23 11.80 : : ; Last Operate Annular 8/17

STRING WT. BHA WI PU WT SO WT. ROT. TORQUE GRO ELEVATION GL TO KB KB ELEVATION INTERMEDIATE CSG LAST CASING NEX YMSING

103,000 58,000 5,839 17 5,856 13.375 g 244C 9.625

DAILY AulMIv
FROM LAST 24 HOURS

o:oo 5:oo 5.00 WAIT ON CEMENT-CLEAN MUD TANKS
5:00 9:00 4.00 CUT OFF - SET OUT CONDUCTOR - MAKE FINALCUT - WELD ON 13-3/8" WELL HEAD
9:00 16:30 7.50 NIPPEL UP BOPS

16:30 21:00 4.50 TEST UPPER & LOWER KELLY VALVES - PIPE & BLIND RAMS - CHOKE MANAFOLD - HCR &
CHOKE LINE VALVES - CHECK VALVE - KILLLINE VALVES - FLOOR SAFTEY VALVE - (ä)
250 PSI FOR 5 MIN. & 5000 PSI FOR 10 MIN. ALL TESTED GOOD.
TEST ANNULAR FOR 5 MIN. g 250 PSI & 10 MIN. g 2500 PSI. - GOOD TEST
TEST 13-3/8" CASING FOR 5 MIN.@ 250 PSI. & 30 MIN. @ 1500 PSI. - GOOD TEST-
PULL TEST PLUG & INSTALL WEAR BUSHING

21:00 23:00 2.00 PICKUP & MAKE UP NEW BHA.-TEST OK
23:00 0:00 1.00 TRIP IN SEP? 5



Engineering &Supervision EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) sos-94oo
Operator: Wolverine GaO Co of Utah, LLc -AIL.Y DRILLING REPORT > nrs - midnight to midnight
DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE API# SUPERVISOR

08/16/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 Rodger Rebsom
DAYSFI SPUD PRESENTOPERATlONS@MIDNIGHT TOTALDEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMATION AUTH. DEPTH

8 WAIT ON CEMENT 2,440 33 3.50 9.4 Arapian 7170 md
MUbDAIA

WT VIS. WL CK PH SAND SOLIDS%PV YP GELS DEPTHDATE/TIMECHLORIDESCALCIUMMBTSALTPPM

9.7 34 NC 2/32 9.0 0.50 6.50 5 15 7/15 2440 8/17-0800 54,000 720 89,100

Bll DAIA
BIT SIZE MFG TYPE lADC SERIALNO. JETS (1/32n<r) IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULL CONDITION
NO CODE orTFA RT+MTR T B G

1 17.500 VARE V-41 638083 4 X 24 120 2210 2090 123.00 17.0 Y 30-120 45 4 8 I
2 17.500 SMITH M655H+ RR MM4358 4 X 28 2210 2440 230 21.50 10.7 Y 30-100 45 3 2 I

#DIVIO!

#DIVIO!

HYDRAULlÒŠ ŠLóW PUMP
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE GAL / ST SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MTRDIFF HHP / IN2 ECD 67 sm 76 sm 100 sm
NO. LENGTH PRESS PRESS

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 100 310 93 108 1425 250 1
2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 100 310 2
3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 100 310 3

DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO
80TTOMHOLEASSEMBLY LENGTH OD I D FORMATION MD TVD LITHOLOGY RIG INFO

BIT 17.500 SURFACE Rig No Unit 111
MOTOR X-OVER 2.870 Cell Ncrren 918-645-6671
X-OVER 3-5/8"HSW 150.880 Last BOP Test

GAsuAIAIBS-REAMER X-OVER 2.400 BOffDMSUPilME BGGAS CONNGAS TRIPGAs NextBOFTest
UBHO 19-5"HSW 576.380 Last Safety Meeting 8/13
MONEL JARS 32.030 GASUNITS F-ROM 10 NOP(EI/HR) Lol BOF Daill
MONEL 3-5"HWDP 89.280 Last Operate Pipe Ra.
PONY MONEL Last Operate BlindRa
SHOCK SUB. 11.80 : : : : : Last Operate Annular

STRINGWT BHAWI PU WT SO WT ROT TORQUE GRD ELEVATION GLTO KB KBELEVATION INTERMEDIATECSG LAST CASING NEXT 3ASING

94,000 58,000 115,000 80,000 240 5,839 17 5,856 20" @120' 13.375 g 250C

SUkv6vs
MD INCL. A21MUT TVD ECTIO N+/S- E+/W- DLS TK MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+lS- E+/W- DLS TOOL

2,127 18.40 235.9 2100 259 -203 -160 1.10 MWD
2,189 19.30 234.3 2158 278 -215 -176 1.67 MWD

DAILYAulIVIIV
FROM LAST 24 HOURS

0:00 3:30 3.50 DRILL FROM 2407' TO 2440' = TD SURFACE.
3:30 5:30 2.00 CIRC.- MIX& PUMP HIGH VIS SWEEPS AROUND-CLEAN HOLE
5:30 7:30 2.00 SHORT TRIP OUT TO 805' - TRIP IN TO 2440' NO FILL
7:30 9:oo 1.50 TRIP OUT TO MONELS - KEEP HOLE FULL - TAKING APPOX. 15 BBL/HOUR
9:00 11:30 2.50 LAY DOWN MONELS-MWD-MUD MOTOR-BIT

11:30 18:oo 6.50 RIG UP RUN 55 JTS. 13-3/8" CASING 62# IFT P110 - LTC - FILL EVERY 5 JTS.
18:00 20:00 2.00 RIG UP FILL CASING - CIRC - WASH CASING 17' TO BOTTOM 10' FILL
20:oo RIG UP CEMENT 13-3/8" CASING - SET ON BOTTOM = 2440' PUMP 10 BBL.H20-20 BBL.GEL FLUSH

FLOWED WITH 655SKS.CBM LIGHT, .25#/SK FLOCELE, 5#/SK GILSONITE,3# GRAR.10.5PPG-4.12CF/SK
26.5GALISK WTR.LEAD-TAIL WITH 475SKS TYPE V 1%CaCI, .25#lSK FLOCELE 15.6PPG-1.18CF/SK
5.2GAL/SK WTR. - DISPLACE 365 BBLSH20-BUMP PLUG.--HELD GOOD RECE23:00 3.00 GOOD CIRC. THREWOUT WHOLE JOB-150 BBLS---CEMENT CIRC. TO RES. PIT

23:00 0:oo 1.00 WAIT ON CEMENT



Engineering & Supervision EXACT Engineering, Inc. (sis) sos-94oo

Operator: WolverineGaocoofUtah,LLc -AIL.Y DRILLING REPORT 2..nrs-midnighttomidnight

DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE API# SUPERVISOR

08/15/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS FI SPUD PRESENT OPERATIONS @MIDNIGHT TOTAL DEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMATION AUTH DEPTH

7 DRILLING 2,407 197 18.00 10.9 Arapian 7170 md
MUbbAIA

WT VIS. WL CK PH SAND SOLIDS% PV YP GELS DEPTH DATE/TIME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MBT SALTPPM

9.6+ 33 NC 2/32 9.0 0.50 6.50 5 15 8/16 2221 8/16-0800 47,000 680 77,550

bil DAIA
BIT SIZE MFG TYPE lADC SERIAL NO. JETS (ifl2ntr) IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULL CONDITION

NO. CODE orTFA RT+MTR T B G

1 17.500 VARE V-41 638083 4 X 24 120 2210 2090 123.00 17.0 Y 30-120 45 4 8 I

2 17.500 SMITH M655H+ RR MM4358 4 X 28 2210 197 18.00 10.9 Y 30-100 45

#DIV/01

#DIVIO!

HYÒRAULIÒS $LÔW PUMP
PUMP MANUFACTURER LINER STROKE GAL / ST SPM GPM AV DP AV DC PUMP MTR DIFF HHP / IN2 ECD 67 sm 76 sm 100 sm
NO. LENGTH PRESS. PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 100 310 93 108 1425 250 1

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 100 310 2

3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 100 310 3

DRILL STRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO
BOTTOMHOLEASSEMBLY LENGTH O.D l.D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHOLOGY RIG INFO

BIT 1.50 17.500 SURFACE Rig No Unit 111

MOTOR 27.96 X-OVER 2.870 Cell Ncrren 918-645-6671

X-OVER 3.04 3-5/8"HSW 150.880 Last BOP Test
uAsuALAIBS-REAMER 5.65 X-OVER 2.400 BOTIOMSUPTIME BGGAS CONNGAS IHIPGAS ^1 I si

UBHO 2.58 19-5"HSW 576.380 Last Safety Meeting 8/13
seloWs

MONEL 31.86 JARS 32.000 GASUNIIS EHUM 10 HOP(FliHH) Leial DOF Diill

MONEL 30.70 3-5"HWDP 89.280 Last Operate Pipe Rat

PONY MONEL 10.08 Last Operate BlindRa

SHOCK SUB. 11.80 Last Operate Annular
srRING WI BHAWE PU WT SO WI ROT. TORQUE GRD ELEVATION GL TO KB KB ELEVATION INÍt-RMEDIAFECSG LASTCASING NEXT ..ASING

94,000 58,000 115,000 80,000 240 5,839 17 5,856 20" @120' 13.375 @2500

SUkü6vs
MD INCL AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+/S- E+/W- DLS TOOL MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+/S- E+/W- DLS TOOL

2,127 18.40 235.90 2100 259 -203 -160 1.10 MWD
2,189 19.30 234.30 2158 278 -215 -176 1.67 MWD

DAILYAcIMI v
FROM LAST24 HOURS:

o:oo 1:30 1.50 HANDLE BHA - TEST MWD.
1:30 3:00 1.50 CUT & SLIP 143' DRILLING LINE
3:00 5:00 2.00 TRIP IN
5:oo e:oo 1.00 WASH & REAM 70' TO BOTTOM
6:oo 0:00 18.00 DRILL FROM 2210' TO 2407'



Engineering &Supervision EXACT Engineering, Inc. (918) soo-94oo

Operator: Wolverine GaO Co of Utah, LLC t.,AILYDRILLING REPORT 29 nrs - midnightto midnight

DATE WELL CONTRACTOR COUNTY, STATE SPUD DATE APl# SUPERVISOR

08/14/05 Wolverine Federal 20-1 Unit Rig #111 Sevier, UT 8/9/05 43-041-30032 Rodger Rebsom
DAYS FI SPUD PRESENTOPERAT10NS@MIDNIGHT TOTALDEPTH PROGRESS DRILLINGTIME ROP FORMAT1ON AUTH DEPTH

6 HANDEL BHA. 2,210 130 19.00 6.8 Arapian 7170 md

MUbbAIA
WT VIS WL CK PH SAND SOLIDS% PV YP GELS DEPTH DATEIDME CHLORIDES CALCIUM MBT SALTPPM

9.8 33 NC 2/32 9.5 0.50 7.50 5 16 9/18 2143 8/14-0800 52,000 720 65,800

bli DAIA
BIT SlZE MFG. TYPE lADC SERIAL NO JETS (int2nd") IN OUT FOOTAGE HOURS ROP MTR RPM WOB DULL CONDITION

NO. CODE orTFA RT+MTR I TT

1 17.500 VAREL V-41 638083 4 X 24 120 2210 2090 123.00 17.0 Y 30-120 45 4 8 I
#VALUE!
#DIV/0!
#DIVIO!

HYDRAULlÒŠ $LÔW PUMP

PUMP MANUFACTURER L1NER STROKE GALISTV SPM GPM AVOP AVOC PUMP MTRDIFF HHPIIN2 ECD fil

NO. LENGTH PRESS. PRESS.

1 National 6" 8.5 2.96 100 310 93 108 1425 250 1

2 National 6" 8.5 2.96 100 310 2

3 National 6" 8.5 2.96 100 310 3

DRILLSTRING GEOLOGIC GENERAL INFO

BOTTOMHOLEASSEMBLY LENGTH OD I D. FORMATION MD TVD LITHOLOGY R1GINFO

BIT 1.50 17.500 SURFACE Rig No Unit 111

MOTOR 27.96 X-OVER 2.870 Cell Ncrren 918-645-6671

X-OVER 3.04 3-5/8"HSW 150.880 Last BOP Test
GANIJAJA

IBS-REAMER 5.65 X-OVER 2.460 aoTTOMSUPT1ME BGGAS CONNGAS TRIPGAs NexlBOPTesi

UBHO 2.58 19-5"HSW 576.380 Last Safety Meeting 8/13
SHOWS

MONEL 31.86 JARS 32.000 GASUNIIS FNOM IO MUP(I-l/MN) I-c.alOOPDahl

MONEL 30.70 3-S"HWDP 89.280 Last Operate Pipe Rat

PONY MONEL 10.08 Last Operate BlindRa

SHOCK SUB. 11.80 : : : : : Last Operate Annular

STRINGWT. SHA Wl. PU WT. SO WT ROT. TORQUE GRD ELEVAT10N GL TO KB KBELEVATION INTERMEDIATECSG LASTCASlNG NEXI 3ASlNG

94,000 68,000 115,000 80,000 240 5,839 17 5,856 20" @ 120' 13.375 g 2500

SUkvi-vs
MD INCL. AZIMUTH TVD SECTION N+ I S- E+ / W- DLS TOOL MO INCL AZ1MUTH TVO SECTION N+ / S- E+ IW- DLS TOOL

2,032 17.50 238.00 2010 231 -188 -136 2.98 MWD

2,127 18.40 236.00 2100 259 -204 -160 1.10 MWD

DAILYAcIMI y
FROM LAST24 HOURS:

0:00 16:30 16.50 DRILL FROM 2080' TO 2192'
16:30 17:00 o.So SERVICE RIG
17:00 19:30 2.50 DRILL FROM 2192' TO 2210' - PRESSURE SPIKES

19:30 21:30 2.00 TRIP OUT - BEARING BAD #2 CONE

21:30 0:00 2.50 HANDEL BHA

SEP? 'i 2005

00



United States Department of the Interior
· BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Utah State Office TAKE PRIDE'P.O. Box 45155 IN ERICA
Salt Lake City,UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
UT-922

February 8, 2006

Wolverine Gas and Oil Corporation
Attn: Richard D. Moritz
One Riverfront Plaza
55 Campau, N.W.
Grand Rapids, Michigan 49503-2616

Re: 5th Revision of the Navajo Formation PA
Wolverine Unit
Sanpete and Sevier Counties, Utah

Gentlemen:

The 5thRevision of the Navajo Formation Participating Area, Wolverine Unit, UTU80800A, is hereby
approved effectiveas of January 1, 2006, pursuant to Section 11 of the Wolverine Unit Agreement,
Sanpete and Sevier Counties, Utah.

The 5thRevision of the Navajo Formation Participating Area results in an addition of 240.40 acres to
the participating area for a total oi 1,039.17 acres and is based upon the completionof Well No. 18-
1, API No. 43-041-30034, located in Lot 12 of Section 18, Township 23 South, Range 1 West
(BHL), SLM&B, Federal Unit Tract No. 6, Fed al Lease UTU73528 and Well No.20-1, API No.43-
041-30032, located in NW¼NW¼ of Sectio , ownship23 South, Range 1 West (BHL),SLM&B,
Federal Unit Tract No. 6, Federall Lease UTU73528, as being wells capable of producing unitized
substances in paying quantities.

Copies of the approved request are being distributed to the appropriate agencies and one copy is
returned herewith. Please advise all interested parties of the establishment of the 5thRevision ofthe
Navajo Formation Participating Area, Wolverine Unit, and the effective date.

Sincerely,

/s/ Douglas F. Cook

Douglas F. Cook
Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure RECElVED

FEBi O2006

DN.0F0\L,GAS&



STATE OF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GASAND MINING

ENTITYACTION FORM

Operator: Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC Operator Account Number: N 1655

Address: 55 Campau NW, One Riverfront Plaza

city Grand Rapids

state MI zip 49503-2616 Phone Number: (616) 458-1150

Well 1

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
4304130032 Wolverine Federal 20-1 NWSE 23S 1W Sevier

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

C 14885 13995 8/9/2005 Og
Comments: SH S W Sec17 2"" CONFilENTIALI

Well 2

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

4304130034 Wolverine Federal 18-1 SESE 18 23S 1W Sevier

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

C 14917 13995 9/6/2005 ÛÚ
Comments: SHL: SESW,Sec.17 m 00NFilENTIALI

WellAPI
Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments: HEUEIVED
MAR0 ß 200$

ACTION CODES:
DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING

A - Establish new entityfor new well(singlewellonly) Edward A. Higuem

B - Add new wellto existingentity(groupor unit well) Name se Pr

C - Re-assign well from one existingentityto another existingentity
D - Re-assign wellfrom one existingentityto a new entity Signat ri

E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) Manager - Developmen /2006
Title Date



CO PYForm3160-4
UNITED STATES(April 2(D‡)

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR FORM APPROVED
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Eprs a

10,
007

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORTAND LOG 5. LeaseSerialNo.
UTU-73528

la. Type of Well Oil Well GasWell Dry Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
b. Type of Completion: New Well Work Over Deepen Plug Back Diff Resvr, . N.A.

Other 7 Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.
Wolverine Fed. Exploration Unit2. Name of Operator Wolverine Gas & Oil Co. of Utah, LLC 8. Lease Nameand WellNo
Wolverine Federal #20-1

3. Address 55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI 49503 3a Phone No. (include area code) 9. AFI Well No.
616-458-1150 4304130032

4. Locationof Well(Report location clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements)* 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
Covenant FieldAt surface 814' FSL & 1,933' FWL, Sec. 17, T23S, R1W

11. Sec.,T., R.,M., on Block and
Attopprod. interval reported below 563' FNL & 681' FWL, Sec. 20, T23S, R1W Survey or Area

12 County or Parish 13 State
At totaldepth 766' FNL & 475' FWL, Sec 20, T23S, R1W Sevier UT

14. DateSpudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16. Date Completed 01/07/2006 17 Elevations(DF, RKB, RT, GL)*
08/09/2005 09/01/2005 D & A Readyto Prod. 5856' KB, 5839' GL

l&. TotalDepth: MD 7158' 19. Plug Back T D.: MD 7109' 20. Depth Bridge Plug Set: MD
TVD 6714' TVD 6666' TVD

21. T e Electric &OtherMechanicalLo Run gubmitcopy ofeach) 22. Was well cored? ONo OYes (Submit analysis)
L'HRI/GR, SDL/DSN/GR Li EMI) 4 . Was DST run? QNo Yes (Submit report)

Directional Survey? ONo Jes (Submitcopy)
23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)

Hole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#/ft.) Top (MD) Bottom (MD) Stage Cementer Noe
of

SCkeå& Slurry Vol. Cement Top* Amount Pulled

30.0" 20" 0.25 wall Surface 120 675 Class G 138 Surf. (CIRC)
17.50" 13-3/8" 61.0 Surface 2440 655 CBM lite 480 Surf. (CIRC)" " "

475Type V 100
12.25" 9-5/8" 47.0 Surface 6350 230 50/50 Poz 70 5300' (CAL)
8.50" 7"/P-110 23.0 Surface 7157 190 50/50 Poz 42 5514' (CBL)

24. Tubing Record
Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) PackerDepth (MD) Size Depth Set(MD) Packer Depth (MD)

2 7/8 6668' KB
25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record

Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No Holes Perf Status
A) Navaio 6467 7158 6760-6838 0.43" 228 open
B)
C)
D)
27. Acid,Fracture,Treatment,CementSqueeze,etc.

Depth Interval Amountand Type of Material
6760-6838 5000 gal 7-1/2% NeFeCI w/ inhibitor & surfactant

28. Production - Interval A
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water OilGravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Cox API Gravity

01/07/2006 01/17/2006 72 1441 Tr 323 Pumped with ESP

Choke TbgPress. Cs8 24Hr Oil Gas Water Gas/Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI 0 480 Tr 108 nil Producing Oil Well

28a. Production - IntervalB
DateFt TD THes

d L MF
ter OCILGry Gas Production Method

FEBO6 2006
Choke Tbg Press Csg. 24Hr Oil Gas Water Gas/Oil Well Status
Size Flwg Press Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

*(Seeinstructions and spacesforadditional dataon page



28b.Production- IntervalC
DateFirst Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water OilGravity Gas ProductionMethod
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr.API Gravity

Choke Tbg.Press. Csg. 24Hr Oil Gas Water Gas/0il Well Status
Size Flwg. Press Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

28c. Production- IntervalD
DateFirst Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water OilGravity Gas ProductionMethod
Produced Date Tested Producton BBL MCF BBL Cerr.API Gravity

Choke Tbg.Press. Csg. 24Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas/0il WellStatus
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

29. Disposition of Gas(Sold,usedforfuel,vented, etc)

venting

30. Summaryof PorousZones(IncludeAquifers): 3L Formation(14) Markers
Showall importantzones of porosityand contents thereof: Coredintervalsand all drill-stem
tests, includingdepthinterval tested,cushion used, timetoolopen, flowing and shut-in pressures
and recoveries.

Formation Top Bottom Descriptions,Contents,etc. Name °E
Meas.Depth

Navajo 6467 7158 Oil &Water Arapien Surface
Twin Creek 6189'
Navajo 6467'

32. Additionalremarks (includepluggingprocedure):

33. Indicatewhich itmeshavebeenattached byplacinga check intheappropriate boxes:

Electrical/MechanicalLogs (1 fullset req'd.) GeologicRepon ODSTReport DirectionalSurvey

O SundryNoticeforpluggingand cement verification O CoreAnalysis Other:

34. Ihereby certify that the foregoingand attached informationis complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

Name(please print) Ellis Peterson Title Sr. Production Engineer

Signatur Date 01/18/2006

Title 18U.S.C Section1001 and Title43 U.S.C Section1212,make it a crime foranypersonknowinglyand willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the United
Statesanyfalse, fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representations as to any matterwithinits



WOLVERINE OPERATING COMPANY
of Utah, LLC

Energy Exploration in Partnership with the Environment

February 2, 2006

Ms. Carol Daniels
Utah Division of Oil Gas & Mining
1594 W.N. Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Re: Wolverine Federal #20-1

Dear Al:

Enclosed please find the following documents for the above referenced well:

• three copies of BLM completion form #3160-4
• directional survey
• geologic report
• mudlog
• Spectral Density, Dual Space Neutron, GR MD & TVD
• HRI MD & TVD
• EMI
• MRIL

Please let me know if you need additional information or have other concerns.

Sincerely,

Helene Bardolph

enclosures

FEBO6 2006

One Riverfront Plaza • 55 Campau, N.W • Grand Rapids, MI 49503-2616 • 616.458.1150
FAX



Weatherford

I
WOLVERINE GAS & OIL

FEDERAL #20-1

SEVIER, UTAH

I

Well Completion Report
Directional Drilling Services

I
I CONF



$
I Company: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah

Lease/Well: Wolverine Federal 20-1
Location: Section17, T23S, 1W
State/Country: Sevier Co, Utah Weatherforf
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I
Job Number: WYLO805DO98 StatelCountry: Sevier Co, Utah

Company: Wolverine Gas & Oil Co of Utah Declination: 12.81

Lease/Well: Wolverine Federal 20-1 Grid:

Location: Section17, T23S, 1W File name: C:\MARSHA~1\ENDOFW~1\WOLVER~1\FE9CE2~1 20

Rig Name: Unit 111 DatelTime: 12-Sep-05 I 11:34

i RKB: 814' FSL & 1933' FWL Curve Name: 20-1

G.L. or M.S.L.:

WINSERVE SURVEY CALCULATIONS
Minirnurn Curvature Method

Vertical Section Plane 219.33
Vertical Section Referenced to Wellhead

Rectangular Coordinates Referenced to Wellhead

Measured IncI Drift True Vertical Dogleg BUILD WALK
Depth Angle Direction Veitical Section N-S E-W Severity RATE RATE

FT Deg Deg Depth FT FT FT Deg/100 Deg/100 Deg/100

.00 .00 .00 .00 .00 .00 .00 .00 .00 .00

173.00 .50 108.10 173.00 -.27 -.23

.72 .29 .29 62.49
266.00 .90 112.70 265.99 -.63 -.64 1.78 .43 .43 4.95
357.00 .10 201.10 356.99 -.76 -.99 2.41 .99

-.88 97.14
448.00 .50 231.80 447.99 -.30 -1.31 2.07 .46 .44 33.74

539.00 1.70 218.10 538.97 1.44 -2.62

.92 1.34 1.32 -15.05

629.00 2.30 221.60 628.91 4.58 -5.02 -1.10

.68 .67 3.89
720.00 3.10 218.50 719.81 8.87 -8.31 -3.84

.89 .88

-3.41

812.00 4.20 220.80 811.62 14.72 -12.81 -7.59 1.21 1.20 2.50
905.00 5.70 209.70 904.27 22.68 -19.40 -12.11 1.91 1.61 -11.94

994.00 6.90 206.70 992.74 32.25 -28.01 -16.70 1.40 1.35 -3.37

1088.00 7.90 210.10 1085.95 44.14 -38.65 -22.48 1.16 1.06 3.62
1182.00 9.10 207.60 1178.92 57.80 -50.83 -29.16 1.34 1.28 -2.66

1276.00 10.10 207.80 1271.60 73.15 -64.70 -36.45 1.06 1.06 .21

1371.00 12.30 205.80 1364.79 91.15 -81.18 -44.74 2.35 2.32 -2.11

1465.00 11.40 204.40 1456.78 109.86 -98.66 -52.94 1.01 -.96 -1.49

1560.00 11.30 209.70 1549.93 128.11 -115.30 -61.43 1.10 -.11 5.58

I 1654.00 10.90 216.20 1642.17 146.07 -130.47 -71.24 1.40 -.43 6.91
1748.00 11.30 219.90 1734.41 164.15 -144.70 -82.39

.87 .43 3.94
1843.00 12.80 229.00 1827.33 183.83 -158.75

-96.31 2.54 1.58 9.58

I 1937.00 14.90 233.60 1918.59 205.81 -172.76 -113.90 2.52 2.23 4.89
2032.00 17.50 237.60 2009.81 231.22 -187.66 -135.79 2.98 2.74 4.21
2127.00 18.40 235.90 2100.19 259.16 -203.72 -160.27 1.10 .95

-1.79

I 2189.00 19.30 234.30 2158.86 278.43 -215.19 -176.69 1.67 1.45 -2.58

2459.00 22.40 235.40 2411.15 371.00 -270.45 -255.29 1.16 1.15 .41

Page 1



Measured Incl Drift True Vertical Dogleg BUILD WALK
Depth Angle Direction Vertical Section N-S E-W Severity RATE RATE

FT Deg Deg Depth FT FT FT Deg/100 Deg/100 Deg/100
2565.00 23.50 228.90 2508.78 411.25 -295.82 -287.85 2.60 1.04 4.13
2659.00 24.30 226.80 2594.72 448.91 -321.38 -316.07 1.24 .85

-2.23

2754.00 27.10 226.60 2680.31 489.76 -349.63 -346.05 2.95 2.95 -.21

2848.00 28.30 221.50 2763.55 533.27 -381.03 -376.38 2.83 1.28 -5.43

2942.00 28.90 218.30 2846.09 578.25 415.55 405.22 1.75 .64

-3.40

3037.00 27.70 216.00 2929.73 623.25 451.43 -432.43 1.71 -1.26 -2.42

3131.00 26.50 215.70 3013.41 665.99 -486.14 -457.51 1.28 -1.28 -.32

3226.00 29.50 218.00 3097.28 710.54 -521.79 -484.28 3.36 3.16 2.42
3320.00 30.40 219.40 3178.73 757.46 -558.41 -513.63 1.21 .96 1.49
3415.00 28.80 217.10 3261.33 804.37 -595.24 -542.69 2.07 -1.68 -2.42

3509.00 28.40 216.40 3343.86 849.32 -631.29 -569.62

.56

-.43 -.74

3604.00 26.80 215.90 3428.05 893.27 466.82 -595.58 1.70 -1.68 -.53

3699.00 26.30 215.50 3513.03 935.64 -701.31 -620.36

.56

-.53 -.42

3793.00 23.60 218.50 3598.25 975.24 -732.99 -644.17 3.17 -2.87 3.19
3888.00 25.50 216.00 3684.66 1014.68 -764.42 -668.03 2.28 2.00 -2.63

3982.00 25.70 214.30 3769.44 1055.18 -797.63 -691.41

.81 .21

-1.81

4077.00 26.60 213.40 3854.71 1096.86 -832.40 -714.73 1.04 .95

-.95

4171.00 27.40 213.60 3938.47 1139.31 -867.99 -738.28

.86 .85 .21

4266.00 27.10 213.20 4022.92 1182.58 -904.30 -762.23

.37

-.32 -.42

4360.00 26.60 214.40 4106.79 1224.83 -939.58 -785.84

.78

-.53 1.28

4455.00 26.60 215.10 4191.74 1267.23 -974.53 -810.09

.33 .00 .74

4549.00 26.20 216.00 4275.93 1308.94 -1008.54 -834.39

.60

-.43

.96

4643.00 27.30 215.10 4359.87 1351.15 -1042.97 -858.98 1.25 1.17 -.96

4738.00 28.10 215.10 4443.98 1395.19 -1079.09 -884.37

.84 .84 .00

4832.00 27.40 215.50 4527.17 1438.85 -1114.82 -909.66

.77

-.74

.43

4927.00 28.20 214.30 4611.21 1483.02 -1151.16 -935.01 1.03 .84

-1.26

5021.00 28.20 216.60 4694.05 1527.33 -1187.33 -960.76 1.16 .00 2.45
5115.00 29.50 218.70 4776.39 1572.66 -1223.23 -988.48 1.75 1.38 2.23
5210.00 27.90 222.00 4859.72 1618.26 -1258.01 -1017.98 2.37 -1.68 3.47
5304.00 27.40 222.50 4942.98 1661.82 -1290.30 -1047.31

.59

-.53

.53

5399.00 25.90 224.50 5027.89 1704.32 -1321.21 -1076.62 1.84 -1.58 2.11
5494.00 24.70 224.50 5113.78 1744.75 -1350.17 -1105.08 1.26 -1.26

.00

5588.00 23.60 225.50 5199.55 1783.02 -1377.37 -1132.26 1.25 -1.17 1.06
5683.00 23.60 227.80 5286.60 1820.74 -1403.47 -1159.92

.97 .00 2.42
5777.00 21.30 230.80 5373.48 1856.08 -1426.91 -1187.09 2.73 -2.45 3.19

5872.00 19.90 235.40 5462.41 1888.53 -1446.99 -1213.77 2.25 -1.47 4.84
5966.00 18.10 233.60 5551.28 1918.06 -1464.75 -1238.70 2.01 -1.91 -1.91

6060.00 18.40 227.30 5640.56 1946.91 -1483.47 -1261.35 2.12 .32

-6.70

6155.00 17.30 226.90 5730.99 1975.76 -1503.29 -1282.69 1.17 -1.16 -.42

6250.00 12.50 220.10 5822.77 2000.06 -1520.82 -1299.63 5.37 -5.05 -7.16

6316.00 12.10 214.40 5887.26 2014.09 -1531.99 -1308.14 1.94 -.61 -8.64

6450.00 11.60 214.10 6018.40 2041.50 -1554.74 -1323.63
.38

-.37 -.22

6513.00 11.20 211.10 6080.16 2053.86 -1565.22
-1330.34 1.14 -.63 -4.76

6639.00 10.40 212.90 6203.93 2077.28 -1585.25 -1342.84
.69

-.63 1.43
6733.00 10.50 213.90 6296.37 2094.23 -1599.48

-1352.23
.22

.11
1.06

Page 2
20-1 File:



Measured Incl Drift True Vertical Dogleg BUILD WALK
Depth Angle Direction Vertical Section N-S E-W Severity RATE RATE

FT Deg Deg Depth FT FT FT Deg/100 Deg/100 Deg/1¾
6828.00 10.60 229.20 6389.78 2111.46 -1612.38 -1363.67 2.94 .11 16.11
6924.00 10.40 232.70 6484.18 2128.59 -1623.40 -1377.25

.70

-.21 3.65
7019.00 10.30 236.10 6577.63 2145.07 -1633.33 -1391.12

.65

-.11 3.58
7113.00 10.50 239.40 6670.09 2161.16 -1642.38 -1405.47

.67 .21 3.51
Projection to bit

7158.00 10.50 239.40 6714.33 2168.86 -1646.55 -1412.53

.00 .00 .00
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1
WELL DATA SUMMARY

WELL NAME WOLVERINE FEDERAL #20-1

OPERATOR WOLVERINE GAS & OIL



BOTTOM HOLE LOCATION NWINW SEC.20.T23S, R1W
SEVIER COUNTY, UT

API # 043 - 041- 30032

WELL CLASSIFICATION DEVELOPMENT COVENANT
FIELD

DRILLING CONTRACTOR UNIT #111

ELEVATION - GROUND LEVEL 5839'
KELLY BUSHING 5856'

SPUD DATE 8-09-05

SURFACE CASING 2447' OF 13 3/8"

INTERMEDIATE CASING 6350' OF 9 5/8"

PRODUCTION CASING 7158' OF 7"

HOLE SIZE 17 ½ ", 12 ¼", 8 ½

SAMPLE INTERVAL 2480 - 7158

GAS DETECTION 2520 - 7158

OPEN HOLE LOGS GR, SP, CAL, HRI, SD-DSN, DIP METER, EMRL

MUD TYPE SATURATED SALT, FLOZAN
WELL STATUS AWAITING COMPLETION

2

FORMATION TOPS

Kelly Bushing 5856'

Formation Prog. (tvd) Spl. (md) Spl. (tvd) Log (md) Log (tvd) Sub Sea

Arapien



Twin Creek 5788 6154 5730 6080 5661 195

Navajo 6156 6456 6035 6467 6035 -168

TD 7158

3

FORMATION EVALUATION

WOLVERINE GAS & OIL CORPORATION
WOLVERINE FEDERAL #20-1

NWINW SEC.20.T23S, R1W
SEVIER COUNTY, UT

The Wolverine Federal #20-1 was the third well drilled on the "B" pad (12-2 site), and the 10th W€ÏÌ
drilled in the Covenant Field. Decollement Consulting began sample coverage at 2490' on Unit Rig #111,
on Aug. 17, 2005. Crews collected 30' logged samples to total depth (7158'). Surface casing (13 3/8")



set to 2447, and 12 ¼" hole drilled to 6366". Intermediate casing (9 5/8") was set at 6350' and 8 ½" hole
drilled to total depth. Seven inch production casing was run to total depth. A full suite of logs was run
including Dip Meter and EMRL. Gas detection was run from 2520' to 7158'.

Navajo 6035 TVD log -168 Sub Sea

The Navajo Sandstone was white, clear, light brown, quartzose, very fine (upper) to coarse (lower)
grained, sub angular to rounded, fair to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 50-90%
unconsolidated, brown oil stain, rainbows on wash water, strong hydrocarbon odor, yellow white oil
fluorescence, yellow white milky cut, yellow gold residual ring cut, 10-14% intergranular porosity.

Conclusion: Oil saturated reservoir - awaiting completion.
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BIT RECORD

WELL NAME WOLVERINE FEDERAL #20-1

LOCATION NWINW SEC. 19, T23S, R1W

SURFACE CASING 2447' OF 13 3/8

SPUD DATE 8-09-05

TD DATE 9-01-05

BIT 1 2 3 4 RR
SIZE 17 ½ 17 ½ 12 ¼ 12 1/4
MAKE STC STC RTC RTC
TYPE V41 M655H EHP43H EHP53A
SERIAL # 638083 MM4358 C41086 05767
JETS 3x28 3x28 3x24 3x24
FOOTAGE 2072 230 269



HOURS 122 21 11 ½ 40
WT 45 45 35 30
RPM 0/30 0/30 0/30 0/30
PP 1350 1350 1350 1500
MUD WT 9.8 9.7 8.6 9.6
VIS 33 34 25 29

BIT 5 6 7 8
SIZE 12 ¼ 12 ¼ 8 ½ 8 1/2
MAKE RTC RTC SEC SEC
TYPE HP53 HP53A EBXS30S ERA33
SERIAL # PB4427 PB4407 12682195 731186
JETS 3x24 3x24 3x12 3x14
FOOTAGE 1542 444 307 492
HOURS 74 43 20 ½ 22
WT 67 45 40 45
RPM 0/30 0/30 0/30 0/25
PP 2040 1870 1000 1260
MUD WT 12.3 10.2 8.4 8.5
VIS 32 32 36 36
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DAILY DRILLING SUMMARY

DATE DEPTH PROG. HRS MUD VIS WL PH ACTIVITY
8-9-05 350 230 9 ½ SPUD DRILL
8-10-05 720 370 18 9.5 29 DRILL TRIP MUD
8-11-05 1270 90 23 ½ 9.8 34 DRILL
8-12-05 1720 450 23 ½ 9.8 34 DRILL
8-13-05 2025 305 23 ½ 10.2 36 DRILL
8-14-05 2198 123 23 ½ 9.7 33 DRILL
8-15-05 2330 132 13 9.7 32 DRILL, TRIP BIT/MOTOR
8-16-05 2440 110 9 ½ 9.7 34 DRILL RUN 13 3/8"
8-17-05 2440 NIL NIL NIPPLE UP, PRES. TEST
8-18-05 2709 269 11 ½ 8.6 26 DRILL TRIP BIT
8-19-05 3245 737 23 9.4 32 DRILL
8-20-05 3618 373 17 9.6 29 DRILL TRIP BIT
8-21-05 4027 429 16 ½ 9.8 30 DRILL RIG REPAIR
8-22-05 4027 NIL NIL TRIP MOTOR, FISH
8-23-05 4248 121 11 ½ 9.9 31 DRILL
8-24-05 1689 448 23 ½ 9.8 31 DRILL
8-25-05 5003 314 15 ½ 9.9 31 DRILL TRIP, MWD



8-26-05 5728 725 23 ½ 10.1 32 DRILL
8-27-05 6129 381 12 ½ 10.2 32 DRILL, Trip Ray GAMMA
8-28-05 6361 NIL NIL DRILL, POOH, RUN 9 5/8"
8-29-05 6361 NIL NIL CEMENT 9 5/8"
8-30-05 6464 103 8 ½ 8.4 36 RIH, DRILL
8-31-05 6621 157 15 ½ 8.5 38 BIT TRIP, DRILL
9-1-05 7158 537 21 8.5 36 DRILL, CIRR& CORD
9-2-05 7158 NIL NIL LOGGING

6

DEVIATION SURVEYS

DEPTH INCLINATION DIRECTION

1654.00 10.90 216.20

1748.00 11.30 219.90

1843.00 12.80 229.00

1937.00 14.90 233.60

2032.00 17.50 237.60

2127.00 18.40 235.90

2189.00 19.30 234.30

2459.00 22.40 235.40

2565.00 23.50 228.90

2659.00 24.30 226.80

2754.00 27.10 226.60

2748.00 28.30 221.50

2942.00 28.90 218.30

3037.00 27.70



3131.00 26.50 215.70

3226.00 29.50 218.00

'3320.00 30.40 219.40

3415.00 28.80 217.10

3509.00 28.40 216.40

3604.00 26.80 215.90

3699.00 26.30 215.50

3793.00 23.60 218.50

3793.00 23.60 218.50

7
DEPTH INCLINATION DIRECTION

3888.00 25.50 216.00

3982.00 25.70 214.30

3982.00 25.70 214.30

4077.00 26.60 213.40

4171.00 27.40 213.60

4266.00 27.10 213.20

4360.00 26.60 214.40
4360.00 26.60 214.40
4455.00 26.60 215.10

4549.00 26.20 216.00

4549.00 26.20 216.00
'4643.00 27.30 215.10
4738.00 28.10 215.10

4832.00 27.40 215.50

4927.00 28.20 214.30

4927.00 28.20 214.30

5021.00 28.20 216.60

5115.00 29.50



5210.00 27.90 222.00

5304.00 27.40 222.50

5399.00 25.90 224.50

5494.00 24.70 224.50

5588.00 23.60 225.50

5683.00 23.60 227.80

5777.00 21.30 230.80
5872.00 19.90 235.40

5966.00 18.10 233.60
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DEPTH INCLINATION DIRECTION

6060.00 18.40 227.30

6155.00 17.30 226.90

6250.00 12.50 220.10
6316.00 12.10 214.40

6450.00 11.60 214.10

6513.00 11.20 211.10

6639.00 10.40 212.90

6733.00 10.50 213.90

6828.00 10.60 229.20

6924.00 10.40 232.70

7019.00 10.30 236.10

7113.00 10.50
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SAMPLE DESCRIPTIONS

Wolverine Gas & Oil Corporation
Wolverine Federal #20-1

2490-2520 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone,
crystalline, dense, in part.

2520-50 SHALE 10% Red brown, silty, firm, blocky.
LIMESTONE 90% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone, silty in
part, chalky in part.

2550-80 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, lithographic, mudstone, anhydrite & calcite
fracture in fill.

2580-2610 SHALE 10% Red brown, silty, blocky, firm, dolomitic.
LIMESTONE 90% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone, silty,
crystalline, dense.

2610-40 SHALE 10% Red brown, silty, blocky, firm, dolomitic.
LIMESTONE 30% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone, silty,
crystalline, dense.
SANDSTONE 40% White, clear, quartzose, very fine to fine granulated, sub angular, fine
to well sorted, clay matrix, tight, anhydrite matrix.
ANHYDRITE 20% White, crystalline, translucent.

2640-70 SHALE 10% Red brown, silty, blocky, firm, dolomitic.
LIMESTONE 40% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone,



crystalline, dense.
ANHYDRITE 50% White, crystalline, translucent.

2670-2700 SHALE 10% Red brown, silty, blocky, firm, dolomitic.
LIMESTONE 80% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone, silty,
crystalline, dense.
ANHYDRITE 10% White, crystalline, translucent.
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2700-30 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, silty, argillaceous, lithographie, mudstone.

2730-60 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, silty, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone.

2760-90 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, crystalline, dense, lithographie, mudstone,
white, chalky in part, abundant anhydrite fracture fill.

2790-2820 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, light to medium gray brown, mottled,
crystalline, dense, abundant anhydrite fracture infill.

2820-50 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, light to medium gray brown, mottled,
crystalline, dense, abundant anhydrite fracture infill, light gray to white, chalky, soft,
mudstone (30%).

2850-80 LIMESTONE 100% Medium to dark gray, dense, firm to hard, mudstone.

2880-2910 LIMESTONE 100% Light gray, white, silty, chalky, mud stone, light to medium gray,
argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone.

2910-40 LIMESTONE 40% Light gray, silty, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone.
SILTSTONE 60% White, argillaceous, limy, blocky, firm, arenaceous.

2940-70 LIMESTONE 30% Light gray, silty, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone.
SILTSTONE 70% White, argillaceous, limy, blocky, firm, arenaceous.

2970-3000 LIMESTONE 70% Light gray, silty, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone.
SILTSTONE 30% White, argillaceous, limy, blocky, firm, arenaceous.

3000-30 LIMESTONE 40% Light gray, silty, argillaceous, lithographie, mudstone.
SILTSTONE 60% White, argillaceous, limy, blocky, firm, arenaceous.

3030-60 LIMESTONE 70% Light gray, silty, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone.
SILTSTONE 30% White, argillaceous, limy, blocky, firm,



11

3060-90 LIMESTONE 90% Light -medium gray, blocky, firm-hard, argillaceous, lithographic,
mudstone, abundant anhydrite fracture infill.
SILTSTONE 10% White, arenaceous, argillaceous, limy, firm-hard, tight.

3090-3120 LIMESTONE 60% Light to medium gray, blocky, firm to hard, argillaceous, lithographic,
mudstone, abundant anhydrite fracture infill.
SILTSTONE 10% White arenaceous argillaceous limy, firm to hard, tight.
ANHYDRITE 30% White chalky, crystalline, sucrosic, in part, trays

3120-50 SHALE 20% Red brown, silty, arenaceous, dolomitic, firm.
ANHYDRITE 50% White chalky, crystalline, sucrosic, in part, trays
LIMESTONE 30% Light to medium gray, blocky, firm to hard, argillaceous, lithographic,
mudstone, abundant anhydrite fracture infill.

3150-80 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographie, mudstone, soft,
chalky in part.

3180-3210 LIMESTONE 30% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone, soft,
chalky in part.
SHALE 20% Red brown, silty, dolomitic, blocky.
SANDSTONE 40% White, clear, quartzose, fine to medium grained, sub angular to
rounded, fine to poor sorted unconsolidated.
ANHYDRITE 10% White, clear, chalky, crystalline.

3210-40 SHALE 80% Red brown, silty, sandy, blocky, earthy, dolomitic, gray green, waxy smooth.
ANHYDRITE 20% White, pink, chalky, soft to firm.

3240-70 SHALE 70% Red brown, silty, sandy, blocky, earthy, dolomitic, gray green, waxy smooth.
ANHYDRITE 30% White, soft, chalky.

3270-3300 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone, soft
chalky in part abundant anhydrite fracture infill.

3300-30 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone, white,
light gray, soft.



3330-60 SHALE 20% Red brown, silty, blocky, dolomitic.
LIMESTONE 60% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone, white,
light gray, soft.
ANHYDRITE 20% Red brown, silty, blocky, dolomitic.

3360-90 SHALE 10% Red brown, silty, blocky, dolomitic.
LIMESTONE 60% White, light gray, earthy, argillaceous, lithographie, mudstone.
ANHYDRITE 30% Red brown, silty, blocky, dolomitic.

3390-3420 SHALE 10% Red brown, silty, blocky, dolomitic.
LIMESTONE 80 % White, light gray, earthy, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone, soft,
chalky in part.
ANHYDRITE 10% Red brown, silty, blocky, dolomitic.

3420-50 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone.

3450-80 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographie, mudstone.

3480-3510 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, white, silty, lithographic, mudstone, chalky
soft.

3510-40 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, white, silty, lithographie, mudstone, chalky
soft.

3540-70 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, brown, crystalline, dense, lithographic,
mudstone, white, soft chalky.

3470-3600 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, brown, crystalline, dense, lithographic,
mudstone, white, soft chalky.

3600-30 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense,
hard, lithographic, mudstone, white, soft, chalky 20%.
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3630-60 LIMESTONE 80% Light to medium gray, light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense,
hard, lithographic, mudstone, white, soft, chalky 20%, 60% white, soft, chalky.
SANDSTONE 20% White, clear, red orange, fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular,



to poor sorted.

3660-90 SHALE 10% Red brown, silty, blocky, dolomitic.
LIMESTONE 80% Light gray brown, tan, crystalline, dense, lithographic, mudstone.
ANHYDRITE 10% White, chalky, crystalline, translucent.

3690-3770 SHALE 20% Red brown, silty, blocky, dolomitic, gray green, blocky, soft to firm, smooth,
waxy.
LIMESTONE 80% Light gray brown, tan, crystalline, dense, lithographic, mudstone.

3720-50 SHALE 10% Red brown, silty, blocky, dolomitic, gray green, blocky, soft to firm, smooth,
waxy.
LIMESTONE 90% Light gray brown, tan, crystalline, dense, lithographic, mudstone.

3750-80 LIMESTONE 80% Light gray brown, tan, light to medium gray, crystalline, dense,
argillaceous, lithographic, mud stone.
ANHYDRITE 20% White, chalky, sucrosic.

3780-3810 LIMESTONE 90% Light gray brown, tan, light to medium gray, crystalline, dense,
argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone, pyrite inclusion, salt cast.
ANHYDRITE 10%.

3810-40 LIMESTONE 80% Light gray brown, tan, crystalline, dense, hard, lithographic, mudstone.
ANHYDRITE 20% White chalky, soft, crystalline, translucent.

3840-70 LIMESTONE 100% Light gray brown, tan, crystalline, dense, hard, lithographic,
mudstone, light to m gray, lithographic, mud stone, white, soft, chalky (20%).

3870-3900 LIMESTONE 60% Light to m gray, silty, argillaceous, lithographic, mud tone.
SILTSTONE 40% White, arenaceous, argillaceous, limy, tight.
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3900-30 LIMESTONE 80% Light to m gray, silty, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone.
SILTSTONE 20% White, arenaceous, argillaceous, limy, tight.

3930-60 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, soft to firm in part, hard to dense in part,
argillaceous, lithographic mudstone.

3960-90 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, hard, dense, lithographic, mudstone,



light gray, soft, chalky, silty.

3990-4020 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, light to medium gray, crystalline, dense,
lithographic, mudstone.

4020-4050 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, light to medium gray, crystalline, dense,
lithographic, mudstone.

4050-80 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, light to medium gray,
argillaceous, earthy, lithographic, mudstone.

4080-4110 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, light to medium gray,
argillaceous, earthy, lithographic, mudstone.

4110-40 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, light to medium gray,
argillaceous, earthy, lithographic, mudstone.

4140-70 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, light to medium gray,
argillaceous, earthy, lithographic, mudstone.

4170-4200 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, light to medium gray,
argillaceous, earthy, lithographic, mudstone.

4200-30 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, light to medium gray,
argillaceous, earthy, lithographic, mudstone.

4230-60 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, light to medium gray,
argillaceous, earthy, lithographic, mudstone.
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4260-90 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, light to medium gray,
earthy, argillaceous, lithographic mudstone, abundant white silty & sandy anhydrite
fracture fill.

4290-4320 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, light to medium gray,
earthy, argillaceous, lithographic mudstone, abundant white silty & sandy anhydrite
fracture fill.

4320-50 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, light to medium gray,
earthy, argillaceous, lithographic mudstone, abundant white silty & sandy anhydrite
fracture fill, 10% white, soft, chalky,



4350-80 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, light to medium gray,
earthy, argillaceous, lithographic mudstone, abundant white silty & sandy anhydrite
fracture fill, 10% white, soft, chalky, silty.

4380-4410 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, light to medium gray,
earthy, argillaceous, lithographic mudstone, abundant white silty & sandy anhydrite
fracture fill, 20% white, soft, chalky, silty.

4410-40 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, light to medium gray,
earthy, argillaceous, lithographic mudstone, abundant white silty & sandy anhydrite
fracture fill, 30% soft, white, chalky, silty.

4440-70 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, light to medium gray,
earthy, argillaceous, lithographic mudstone, abundant white silty & sandy anhydrite
fracture fill, 50% white, soft, chalky, marly, silty.

4470-4500 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, light to medium gray,
earthy, argillaceous, lithographic mudstone, abundant white silty & sandy anhydrite
fracture fill, 10% soft white, soft, chalky, marly, silty.

4500-30 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, lithographie,
mudstone, white soft, chalky, silty, 20%.

4530-60 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, firm, hard, lithographic, mudstone.
16

4560-90 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, light to medium gray,
argillaceous, earthy, lithographie, mudstone, white, soft, chalky, silt & sandy, in part.

4590-4620 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, light to medium gray,
argillaceous, earthy, lithographie, mudstone, white, soft, chalky, silt & sandy, in part.

4620-50 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, light to medium gray,
argillaceous, earthy, lithographic, mudstone, white, soft, chalky, silt & sandy, in part.

4650-80 LIMESTONE 60% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, argillaceous,
lithographic, mudstone.
SILTSTONE 40% Light gray, light gray brown, arenaceous, argillaceous, limey, hard,
blocky.

4680-4710 SHALE 10% Red brown, blocky, dolomitic, silty, firm to



SILTSTONE 20% Light gray, light gray brown, arenaceous, argillaceous, limey, hard,
blocky.
LIMESTONE 70% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, argillaceous,
lithographic, mudstone.

4710-40 LIMESTONE 70% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, argillaceous,
lithographic, mudstone.
SILTSTONE 30% Light gray, light gray brown, arenaceous, argillaceous, limey, hard,
blocky.

4740-70 LIMESTONE 70% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, argillaceous,
lithographic, mudstone.
SILTSTONE 30% Light gray, light gray brown, arenaceous, argillaceous, limey, hard,
blocky.

4770-4800 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone, abundant
anhydrite fracture in fill.

4800-30 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, light to medium gray brown, very fine to fine
crystalline in part, sucrosic texture, argillaceous, earthy, in part, lithographic, mudstone,
dense, crystalline, in part.
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4830-60 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, lithographic,
mudstone, abundant anhydrite fracture in fill.

4860-90 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, lithographic,
mudstone, abundant anhydrite fracture in fill.

4890-4920 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, lithographic,
mudstone, abundant anhydrite.

4920-50 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, lithographic,
mudstone, white, soft, chalky, (10%) abundant anhydrite fracture in fill.

4950-80 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, firm to hard, mottled,
sucrosic texture in part, lithographic, mudstone, abundant anhydrite fracture in fill.

4980-5010 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, firm to hard, mottled,
sucrosic texture in part, lithographic, mudstone, abundant anhydrite fracture in



5010-40 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, firm to hard, mottled,
sucrosic texture in part, lithographic, mudstone, abundant anhydrite fracture in fill.

5040-70 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, firm to hard, mottled,
sucrosic texture in part, lithographic, mudstone, abundant anhydrite fracture in fill.

5070-5100 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, firm to hard, mottled,
sucrosic texture in part, lithographic, mudstone, abundant anhydrite fracture in fill.

5100-30 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, firm to hard, mottled,
sucrosic texture in part, lithographic, mudstone, abundant anhydrite fracture in fill.

5130-60 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone, light to
medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, hard, abundant anhydrite fracture in fill.
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5160-90 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone, light to
medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, hard, abundant anhydrite fracture in fill, light gray
brown, very fine to fine crystalline, sucrosic texture, sandy, abundant, white, crystalline,
anhydrite.

5190-5220 LIMESTONE 80% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone, light to
medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, hard, abundant anhydrite fracture in fill, light gray
brown, very fine to fine crystalline, sucrosic texture, sandy, abundant, white, crystalline,
anhydrite.
SILTSTONE 20% White, light gray, arenaceous, argillaceous, anhydrite matrix, dolomitic.

5220-50 LIMESTONE 90% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone, light to
medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, hard, abundant anhydrite fracture in fill, light gray
brown, very fine to fine crystalline, sucrosic texture, sandy, abundant, white, crystalline,
anhydrite.
SILTSTONE 10% White, light gray, arenaceous, argillaceous, anhydrite matrix, dolomitic.

5250-80 LIMESTONE 70% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone, light to
medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, hard, abundant anhydrite fracture in fill, light gray
brown, very fine to fine crystalline, sucrosic texture, sandy, abundant, white, crystalline,
anhydrite.
SILTSTONE 20% Light gray, white, arenaceous, argillaceous, dolomitic, anhydritic.
SHALE 10% Red brown, silty, dolomitic, blocky,



5280-5310 SHALE 30% Red brown, silty, sandy, blocky, dolomitic, firm.
ANHYDRITE 10% White, silty, sandy, chalky, soft.
LIMESTONE 60% Light to medium gray brown, tan, crystalline, dense.

5310-40 SHALE 40% Red brown, silty, sandy, blocky, dolomitic, firm, abundant salt casts.
ANHYDRITE 10%
LIMESTONE 50% Light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense, light to medium gray,
argillaceous, earthy, mudstone.

5340-70 SHALE 40% Red brown, silty, dolomitic, blocky, firm, salt casts.
SILTSTONE 30% Red brown, arenaceous, argillaceous, dolomitic.
LIMESTONE 30% Light to medium gray, crystalline, argillaceous, dense, mudstone.
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5370-5400 SHALE 20% Red brown, silty, dolomitic, blocky, firm, salt casts.
SILTSTONE 30% Red brown, arenaceous, argillaceous, dolomitic.
LIMESTONE 40% Light to medium gray, crystalline, argillaceous, dense, mudstone.
ANHYDRITE 10% White, chalky, soft.

5400-30 SHALE 20% Red brown, silty, argillaceous, dolomitic, salt casts.
SILTSTONE 20% Light gray, arenaceous, argillaceous.
LIMESTONE 50% Lithographic to medium gray, lithographic, mudstone.
ANHYDRITE 10% White, chalky, soft.

5430-60 SHALE 30% Red brown, silty, argillaceous, dolomitic, salt casts.
LIMESTONE 60% Lithographic to medium gray, lithographic, mudstone.
ANHYDRITE 10%White, sucrosic, anhydrite.

5460-90 SHALE 30% Red brown, silty, argillaceous, dolomitic, salt casts.
LIMESTONE 50% Lithographic to medium gray, lithographic, mudstone.
SILTSTONE 20% Light gray, arenaceous, argillaceous.

5490-5520 SHALE 30% Red orange, silty, dolomitic, blocky.
SILTSTONE 20% Red brown, arenaceous, argillaceous, dolomitic, firm.
LIMESTONE 50% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone.

5520-50 SHALE 40% Red orange, silty, dolomitic, blocky.
SILTSTONE 30% Red brown, arenaceous, argillaceous, dolomitic, firm.
LIMESTONE 20% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone.
ANHYDRITE 10% White, soft,



5550-80 SHALE 30% Red orange, silty, dolomitic, blocky.
SILTSTONE 30% Red brown, arenaceous, argillaceous, dolomitic, firm.
LIMESTONE 20% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone.
ANHYDRITE 20% White, chalky, soft, clear translucent.

5580-5610 SHALE 40% Red orange, silty, dolomitic, blocky.
SILTSTONE 30% Red brown, arenaceous, argillaceous, dolomitic, firm.
LIMESTONE 20% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographie, mudstone.
ANHYDRITE 10% White, soft, chalky.
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5610-5640 SHALE 30% Red orange, silty, dolomitic, blocky.
SILTSTONE 30% Red brown, arenaceous, argillaceous, dolomitic, firm.
LIMESTONE 30% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone.
ANHYDRITE 10% White, soft, chalky.

5640-70 SHALE 30% Red orange, silty, dolomitic, blocky.
SILTSTONE 10% Red brown, arenaceous, argillaceous, dolomitic, firm.
LIMESTONE 20% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographie, mudstone.
ANHYDRITE 40% Crystalline, clear, translucent.

5670-5700 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, hard, dense, crystalline, lithographic,
mudstone. (Note; no spill coming over shaker - roughneck caught cutting from possum belly
that came from up hole - drilling 100% salt. No return over shaker screen.)

5700-30 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, hard, dense, crystalline, lithographic,
mudstone.

5730-60 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, hard, dense, crystalline, lithographic,
mudstone.

5760-90 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, hard, dense, crystalline, lithographic,
mudstone.

5790-5820 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, hard, dense, crystalline, lithographic,
mudstone.

5820-50 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, hard, dense, crystalline, lithographic,
mudstone.

5850-80 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, hard, dense, crystalline, lithographic,



5880-5910 SHALE 10% Red brown, silty, color.
LIMESTONE 80% Light gray, argillaceous, earthy, lithographic, mudstone.
ANHYDRITE 10% White, soft, chalky.
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5910-40 SHALE 20% Red brown, silty, color.
LIMESTONE 60% Light gray, argillaceous, earthy, lithographic, mudstone.
ANHYDRITE 20% White, soft, chalky.

5940-70 SHALE 10% Red brown, silty, color.
LIMESTONE 80% Light gray, argillaceous, earthy, lithographic, mudstone.
ANHYDRITE 10% White, soft, chalky.

5970-6000 SHALE 10% Red brown, silty. blocky, dolomitic.
LIMESTONE 70% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, earthy, lithographic, mudstone.
ANHYDRITE 20% White, soft, chalky, silty.

6000-6030 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, earthy, lithographic, mudstone.

6030-60 LIMESTONE 100% Tan, light brown, light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense,
micro crystalline, light to medium gray.

6060-90 SHALE 10% Red brown, silty, dolomitic, blocky, firm.
LIMESTONE 90% Tan, light brown, light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense,
micro crystalline, light to medium gray.

6090-6120 LIMESTONE 100% Tan, light brown, light to medium gray brown, crystalline, dense,
micro crystalline, light to medium gray, abundant, white, anhydrite fracture in fill.

6120-50 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, argillaceous, lithographic, mudstone, 20% soft,
chalky, firm, abundant anhydrite.

6150-80 LIMESTONE 100% Light medium to gray brown , tan, crystalline, dense, hard, tight,
lithographic, mudstone.

6180-6210 LIMESTONE 100% Light medium to gray brown , tan, crystalline, dense, hard, tight,
lithographic, mudstone.

6210-40 LIMESTONE 100% Light medium to gray brown , tan, crystalline, dense, hard, tight,
lithographie,
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6240-70 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium to gray brown , tan, crystalline, dense, hard, tight,
lithographie, mud stone.

6270-6300 LIMESTONE 100% Medium to dark gray brown, brown, light medium gray brown, tan,
crystalline, in part, pack stone to grain stone, mud stone matrix , pellets, oolitic.

6300-30 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray brown, tan, light brown, crystalline, dense, pack
stone to grain stone mudstone matrix, very fine to fine crystalline & sucrosic in part .

6330-60 LIMESTONE 100% Light to medium gray, medium to dark gray, crystalline, dense,
lithographic, mudstone.

6360-90 LIMESTONE 100% Light gray, white, silty, sandy, chalky in part, light to medium gray
brown, crystalline, dense pink stone to green stone in part, mudstone matrix, very fine to
fine crystalline & sucrosic in part, lithographic, mud tone.

6390-6420 LIMESTONE 100% Medium to dark gray, argillaceous, earthy, hard, crystalline,
mudstone.

6420-50 SHALE 30% Red brown, silty, sandy, dolomitic, blocky, firm to hard.
SILTSTONE 20% Red brown, white, arenaceous, argillaceous, limy, firm.
LIMESTONE 50% Light to medium gray, crystalline, dense, abundant fracture in fill, light
brown, tan, pink, micro crystalline, dense, hard, tight, mudstone.

6450-6480 LIMESTONE 90% Medium to dark gray, crystalline, dense, argillaceous, earthy, dolomitic,
mudstone.
SANDSTONE 10% white, clear, quarts, fine to medium grained, sub angular to rounded,
fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 8-12% intrgranular porosity,
brown oil stained, yellow to white, oil fluorescence yellow to white milky cut fluorescence,
yellow to gold residual ring.
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6480-6510 LIMESTONE 10% Light to medium gray, sandy, argillaceous, lithographic, mud



SANDSTONE 90% White, clear, quartzose, fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular to
rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 50% unconsolidated,
10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained in
matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring cut.

6510-40 SANDSTONE 100% White, clear, quartzose, fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular to
rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 85% unconsolidated,
10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained in
matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring cut.

6540-70 SANDSTONE 100% White, clear, quartzose, fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular to
rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 95% unconsolidated,
10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained in
matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring cut, abundant blocky heavy oil in clasts matrix.

6570-6600 SANDSTONE 100% White, clear, quartzose, fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular to
rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 95% unconsolidated,
10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained in
matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring cut.

6600-30 SANDSTONE 100% White, clear, quartzose, fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular to
rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 90% unconsolidated,
10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained in
matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring cut.

6630-60 SANDSTONE 100% White, clear, quartzose, very fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular
to rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 70% unconsolidated,
10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained in
matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring cut.
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6660-90 SANDSTONE 100% White, clear, quartzose, very fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular
to rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 75% unconsolidated,
10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained in
matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring



6690-6720 SANDSTONE 100% White, clear, quartzose, fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular
to rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 98% unconsolidated,
10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained in
matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring cut.

6720-50 SANDSTONE 70% White, clear, quartzose, very fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular
to rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 70% unconsolidated,
10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained in
matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring cut, abundant white, hard, tight.
SHALE 20% Red brown, silty, blocky, firm to hard, dolomitic.
ANHYDRITE 10% White, soft, chalky.

6750-80 SANDSTONE 100% White, clear, quartzose, fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular
to rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 98% unconsolidated,
10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained in
matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring cut.

6780-6810 SANDSTONE 100% White, clear, quartzose, fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular
to rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 98% unconsolidated,
10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained in
matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring cut.
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6810-40 SANDSTONE 100% White, clear, quartzose, very fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular
to rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 98% unconsolidated,

10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained in
matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring cut.

6840-70 SANDSTONE 100% White, clear, quartzose, very fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular
to rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 85% unconsolidated,
10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained



matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring cut.

6870-6900 SANDSTONE 100% White, clear, quartzose, very fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular
to rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 90% unconsolidated,
10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained in
matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring cut.

6900-30 SANDSTONE 100% White, clear, quartzose, fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular
to rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 98% unconsolidated,
10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained in
matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring cut, weak to no show mixed zone.

6930-60 SANDSTONE 100% White, clear, quartzose, very fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular
to rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 95% unconsolidated,
10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained in
matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring cut, no show.

6960-90 SANDSTONE 100% White, clear, quartzose, very fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular
to rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 95% unconsolidated,
10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained in
matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring cut, no show.
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6990-7020 SANDSTONE 100% White, clear, quartzose, fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular
to rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 98% unconsolidated,
10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained in
matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring cut, no show.

7020-50 SANDSTONE 100% White, clear, quartzose, very fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular
to rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 70% unconsolidated,
10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained in
matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring cut, no show.

7050-80 SANDSTONE 100% White, clear, quartzose, fine to coarsely granulated, sub



to rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 98% unconsolidated,
10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained in
matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring cut, no show.

7080-7110 SANDSTONE 100% White, clear, quartzose, fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular
to rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 98% unconsolidated,
10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained in
matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring cut, no show.

7110-40 SANDSTONE 100% White, clear, quartzose, fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular
to rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 98% unconsolidated,
10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained in
matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring cut, no show.

7140-58 SANDSTONE 100% White, clear, quartzose, very fine to coarsely granulated, sub angular
to rounded, fine to poor sorted, clay matrix, siliceous cement, friable, 98% unconsolidated,
10-14% intrgranular porosity, strong hydro carbon odor, rainbows, brown oil stained in
matrix, yellow to white oil fluorescence, yellow to white milky cut, yellow to gold residual
ring cut, no



Fonn 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
(September 2001) OMB No. 1004-0135

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires January 31, 2004

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease SerialNo.
SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-73528

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side 7. IfUnitorCA/Agreement,Nameand/orNo.

1. TypeofWell
VVolverine Fed Exploration Unit

Oil Well Ü Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Wolverine Federal #20-1
Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC 9. APIWellNo.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-041-30032-00-00
55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI 49503 (616) 458-1150 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Locationof Well (Footage, Sec., T.,R., M., or SurveyDescription) Exploratory
Surface: 833' FSL & 1,925' FWL, SE/SW, Sec 17, T23S, R1W 11. CountyorParish,State

Bottom: 660' FNL & 660 FWL, NWINW, Sec 20, T23S, R1W Sevier County, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Acidize Deepen Ü Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Notice of Intent Alter Casing Fracture Treat Ü Reclamation Wen Integrity

O Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Work-over

O Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon
Final Abandonment Notice Ü Convertto Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or CompletedOperation (clearly state all pertinent details, includingestimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC plan to undertake a work-over on the Wolverine Federal 20-1, which is part of
the Covenant Field. Based on the analysis of the well, the existing perforations are under performing. Therefore, we intend to
acid treat existing perforations. We also intend to perforate additional pay intervals in the Lower Navajo at 6721-6744' MD,
6699-6712' MD, and 6684-6691. Once the work in completed, the well will be returned to production.

COPYSENTTOOPERATOs RECEIVED
Date: WuAt> JUN14 2010
initials: |Ê DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoin is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Edward A. Higuera Title Manager Development

Sign Date 06-11-2010

THI SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditionsof approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or 6800(8 Appf0V8l QÌ 016
ce that thee lt

ap
iledant cl ontdueet ebraete therthoserights in the subject lease Office O 6 ACli00 IS Necessar?

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter wittun its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on



Fo 5 UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
(Sep 2001) OMB No. 1004-0135

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires January 31, 2004

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-73528
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

N/A

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side

1. Type of Well
Wolverine Fed Exploration Unit

Oil Well Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Nameof Operator Wolverine Federal #20-1
Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC 9. API WellNo.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-041-30032-00-00
55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI 49503 616-458-1150 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location W411/F otage, Se ., T, .LRM, or Survey Description) Covenant Field
Surface: 833' FL & 1,925' FWL, SE/SW, Sec 17, T23S, R1W 11. County or Parish, State

Bottom: 660' FNL & 660 FWL, NW/NW, Sec 20, T23S, R1W Sevier County, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

$ Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off
O Notice of Intent Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Wen Integrity

Subsequent Report Z Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

O Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon
O Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Dates: 6/14/2010 to 6/25/2010

The Wolverine Federal 20-1 had a cement squeeze pumped througha CICR set at 6870' to repair a hole in the casing at
6884'. The well was then acidized through the existing perforation intervals of 6760' - 6782', 6800' - 6816' and 6828' -

6838'. Finally, an additional perforation interval was added at 6721' - 6744' with 6 spf.
A successful cement squeeze was pumped with 10 bbls of fresh water followed by 30 sacks of 15.8# 1.15Y cement followed
by 38.5 bbis of fresh water throughthe CICR and the tubing was released from the retainer. The remaining cement above the
retainer was reverse circulated out with a new PBTD of 6860'. Maximum injection pressure during the squeeze reached 1920
psi at 2 BPM.
A RBP and packer were set at 6822' and 6667'respectively to pump 3800 gallons of 15% FE acid containing 125 7/8" BioBall
sealers and 200 Buoyant Balls into the existing perforation intervals. Maximum injection pressure reached 3986 psi at 1.6
BPM with no evident ball action present due to the low injection rate. The RBP was reset and the 6721' - 6744' intervalwas
perforated with 6 spf. ESP equipment was rerun, and the well was returned to production.

14. I herebycertify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Matthew Rivers Title Production Engineer

Signature Date 12/01/2010

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Offwhich would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Ice

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter witnin its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on reverse) HELE IVEU
DECO6 2010

nlU fW (311 (2AR A



WOLVERINE GAS AND OIL COMPANY
OF UTAH, LLC

Energy Exploration in Partnership with the Environment

December 1, 2010

Mr. Gil Hunt
Utah Division of Oil Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple
Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, UT 84116

Dear Mr. Hunt:

Today I electronically submitted a sundry and enclosed is another sundry for Wolverine Gas and
Oil, LLC wells located in Sevier County, Utah. Both the Kings Meadow Ranches 17-7 and the
Wolverine Federal 20-1 were worked on this year in an effort to increase production.

Please feel free to contact either Matt Rivers or myself if you have any questions regarding these
documents.

Regards,

Helene Bardolph
Wolverine Gas and Oil Corp.
616-458-1150 xll36
hbardolph@wolvgas.com

RECEIVED
DEC08 2010

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

One Riverfront Plaza • 55 Campau, N.W • Grand Rapids, MI 49503-2616 • 616.458.1150 • FAX



\ woLVER E Covenant Field

Federal 20-al SE/SW Sec 17, T23N, R1W

V API#43-041-30032 Sevier County, Utah

5/14/2012 Moved in frac tanks, rig pump, pipe racks and rig baskets.
5/15/2012 Hooked up flowback lines, filled frac tanks with KCL water and laid out oil absorbent matting around well.

5/16/2012 Crew travel to location, MIRUSU, ND wellhead, NU BOPs.

5/17/2012 Opened well, O psi tubing,O psi casing. RU cable spoolers, pulled out of hole with tubingand ESP equipment.
RD and release spooling equipment, trippedin hole with open ended tubingand tagged cement top at 7112',
picked up and spaced tubingout 1' offof cement topat 7111'. RU pump lines and circulated well clean with

fresh water. SWIFN

Note: No corrosion to the ESP equipment or tubulars.
Plan to squeeze lower Navajo 1 perforations.

5/18/2012 Opened well, 0 psi. RU Halliburton cementing equipment, and pumped cement squeeze as follows:

1. Pumped 12 bbis of fresh water to fillwellbore.
2. Pump 50 sks (10.24 Bbis) of 15.8 Ib/gal squeezecem cement

3. Pump 5 Bbl FW spacer

4. Displace with29 Bbis 4% KCL
5. RD pump lines

6. Pull out of hole with 10 joints
7. RU pump lines

8. Squeezed 1.5 bbis at 0.5 bpm witha max pressure of 800 psi

9. SD for 4 minutes, pressure held at 800 psi

10. Squeezed 0.5 bbls at 0.5 bpm with a max pressure of 1200 psi

11. SD for 1 minutes, pressure held at 1200 psi

12. Squeezed 0.5 bbis at 0.5 bpm with a max pressure of 1500 psi

13. SD for 4 minutes, pressure held at 1500 psi

14. Bled pressure off and RD pump lines

15. TlH with tubingto 7020' and reversed out with 65 bbls of 4% water.

16. Pulled out of hole with 20 joints
17. RU pump lines and pressured well to 500 psi.

SWIFN
Plan to pressure test cement squeeze / swab fluidlevel down to 2500' / perforate 6973'-6982' / TlH with

tubing,packer and plug.

5/19/2012 Opened well, 560 psi. RU pump lines and pressure tested cement squeeze to 2000 psi. RD pump lines, RU

swab equipment and swabbed fluid level down to 2500', RD swab equipment and pulled out of hole with tubing.
RU wireline unit and perforated well as follows:

Perf interval - 6973'-6982'
Titan Part # EXP 3325-321T

.41 entry hole

25 gram charges
45.16" penetration

4" EXP gun loaded 6 spf on 60° phasing.
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RD and released wireline unit, picked up and trippedin hole with bridge plug, retrieving head, 4' sub, HD

packer, 1 joint, SN and 210 jointsof tubing.While trippingin the hole on joint210 the bridge plug set itself,

during the attempt to release the bridge plug the packer was set as well. This prevented any chance of

releasing the plug and packer combination. SWIFN

Note: Tagged PBTD with perforating gun, estimated PBTD @7024'

Note: Plug was stuck at 6513'

Plan to cut the tubingsub between the packer and plug / pull out of hole with packer / Trip in and release plug.

5/20/2012 Opened well, 0 psi. RU wireline unit and run in hole with chemical cutter and made a cut on the4' tubingsub
between the packer and plug. Pulled out of hole withcutter and unsuccessfully triedto release the packer.

Rigged up a second chemical cutter and made a second cut on the 4' tubingsub between the packer &plug,

pulled out of hole with the cutter and was able to release the packer. RD and released wireline unit and pulled

out of hole with tubing,packer and cut sub. Picked up and run in hole with overshot, xo, bumper sub, jar, xo,

6' sub, one joint,4' sub and tubingto surface. Latched onto fish and made several unsuccessful attempts to
release the plug. Released the retrieving head from the bridge plug and pulled out of hole with tubing, fishing

toolsand retrieving head. SWIFN.

Plan to TIH with tubingand retrieving head / RU power swivel and work the plug free.

5/21/2012 Opened well, 0 psi. Picked up and run in hole with retrieving head, xo, bumper sub, jars, xo, 6' sub and tubing
to surface. RU power swivel and torqued tubingto the right then set off jars and pulled plug free. RD power

swivel and pulled out ofhole with tubingand retrievable plug. Picked up a new packer and plug combination

and run in the hole and stuck the plug in the same spot at 6513', worked the plug up hole for approximately 3'

then set back down and dog locked the plug and packer for a second time.
Plan to cut off the tubingsub between the plug and pkr / pull out of hole with tools / run casing inspection log.

5/22/2012 RU wireline unit and run in hole with 2 1/8" chemical cutter and cut off the 8' sub between the tubing and

packer, RD wireline unit. Pulled out of hole with tubingpacker and plug. RU wireline unit and run a casing

inspection log from 6750' to 5000' with a 60 finger imaging tool.Casing damage was found as follows:

5336' Minor damage

5940' Minor damage

6064' Minor damage

6382' Minor damage

6494' Minordamage
6513' Collapsed to 5.6" ID

Due to problems with the logging toolor debris on the casing walls the exact ID of the specific areas were not
determined. The estimated ID at the problem area of 6513' was 5.6"

Plan to order casing and liner equipment to be run from 7023'-5023'

5/23/2012 Rig crew moved pipe racks and prepared location for casing and drill collars.

5/24/2012 No activity,rig crew on days off
5/25/2012 No activity, rig crew on days off

5/26/2012 No activity,rig crew on days off
5/27/2012 No activity, rig crew on days off
5/28/2012 No activity, rig crew on days off

5/29/2012 Set pipe racks and hydraulic cat walk, unloaded drillcollars and 4 1/2" 11.6# P110 casing and staged on racks.
Plan to run a 4 1/2" x 5' piece of casing with collars on both ends to PBTD prior to running casing liner on 5/31.

5/30/2012 Crew travelto location, unloaded casing liner hanger. RU wireline unit and RIH with 5' of 4-1/2" casing with
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collars on both ends to PBTD, pulled out of hole withcasing drift, RD and released wireline unit.
Plan to install casing liner.

5/31/2012 Opened well, 0 psi. Picked up and run in hole withfloat shoe, float collar, landing collar, 45 jointsof new 4-1/2"

P110 Brd 11.6# casing, 3-1/2" IF x 2 7/8" xo, hanger, pkr, liner top,setting tool,bumper sub, 28 4-3/4" x 3-1/2"

drillcollars and 3-1/2"x2 7/8" xo. RU pump lines and circulated 85 bbis of fresh water throughliner to confirm

circulation and remove oil from the annulus.
Plan to finish running in hole with liner I cement.

6/1/2012 Opened well, 0 psi. Finished trippingin hole with 2 7/8" tubing,tagged cement top at 7024', picked up 2'. RU

Halliburton cementing equipment and cemented liner in hole as follows:

1. Pumped 20 bbls of fresh water to establish circulation
2. Pressure tested lines to 4400 psi

3. Set liner

4. Pumped 10 bbis fresh water

5. Pumped 43 bbis (210 sks) of 15.8 ppg Premium G cement slurry yield 1.15 ft3/sk water 4.92 gallsk

6. Dropped wiper plug

7. Pumped 59 bbls of fresh water - Bumped plug and pressured to 2784 psi
8. Set packer and pressure tested to 1600 psi

9. Reverse circulated out with 85 bbis of 4% KCLwater
RD and released cementing equipment. Pulled out of hole laying down 28, 4-3/4" drill collars and setting tool.
SWIFN, Plan to run in hole with bit and scraper.
Note: See 4.5" Liner install settings tab for details

See 4.5" Liner cementing graph for details

6/2/2012 Opened well, 0 psi. Picked up and run in hole with 3 7/8" bit, casing scraper, xo, 69 joints of 2 3/8" tubing,xo,

and 156 jointsof 2 7/8" tubing,tagged up at 6977', rigged up power swivel and rotated pipe while reverse

circulating down to PBTD at 7018'. Reversed 55 bbis of 4% KCL, RD pump lines and pulled out of hole withbit
and casing scraper. SWIFN

Plan to perforate / swab perf intervals at 6973'-6982'

6/3/2012 Opened well, 0 psi. RU wireline unit and perforated well as follows:
Perf interval - 6973'-6982'

Owen Part # SDP-3125-411NT4

.37 entry hole

25 gram charges
42.90" penetration (35.6" thru4 1/2" liner and 7" casing string)
4" EXP gun loaded 6 spf on 60° phasing.

RD and released wireline unit, picked up and trippedin hole with bridge plug, retrieving head, 1 joint2 3/8"

tubing,packer, 68 joints2 3/8" tubing,xo, 4' sub, cup type SN and 2 7/8" tubingto surface. Set plug at 6999',

set packer at 6898' with EOT at 6935'. RU pump lines, pressure tested packer to 1000 psi, RD pump lines, RU

swab equipment and made two swab runs with no entry, RU pump lines, loaded tubingwith 4% KCL and
pressured up to 1500 psi with an approximate 350 psi bleed off in 10 minutes. Re pressured threetimes to
1500 psi with similar results. SWIFN
Plan to pump acid into pref interval 6973'-6982' / swab back for rate and clean up.

6/4/2012 Opened well, 0 psi tubing,0 psi casing. RU Halliburton acid equipment and pumped acid jobon perf interval

6973'-6982' as follows:
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Detail Bbls Cumm Max Max
BPM PSI

Pumped CF to filltubing 0 0 0 0
Opened bypass on packer ~ ~ ~ ~

Spotted 7 1/2% FE HCL 23.84 23.84 2 390
Spotted 4% KCL 11.02 34.86 2 2500
Closed bypass on packer ~ ~ ~ ~

Pumped 7 1/2% FE HCL 0.13 34.99 0.5 1015

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.05 35.04 0.5 1996
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.04 35.08 0.5 1973

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.05 35.13 0.5 2431

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.02 35.15 0.5 2500

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.02 35.17 0.5 2540

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.01 35.18 0.5 2527

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.02 35.2 0.5 2517
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.02 35.22 0.5 2492

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.01 35.23 0.5 2720

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 35.26 0.5 2540

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.02 35.28 0.5 2527

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 35.31 0.5 2517

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 35.34 0.5 2492

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 35.37 0.5 2503
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.04 35.41 0.5 2471
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.02 35.43 0.5 2475

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.04 35.47 0.5 2499

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 35.5 0.5 2483
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Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 35.53 0.5 2460

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 35.56 0.5 2439

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 35.59 0.5 2470

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 35.62 0.5 2541

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 35.65 0.5 2494

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 35.68 0.5 2507

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.04 35.72 0.5 2494
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 35.75 0.5 2490

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 35.78 0.5 2458

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 35.81 0.5 2471

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 35.84 0.5 2413

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 35.87 0.5 2485

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 35.9 0.5 2493

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 35.93 0.5 2434

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 35.96 0.5 2491

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 35.99 0.5 2474

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 36.02 0.5 2508

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 36.05 0.5 2486

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 36.08 0.5 2489

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.03 36.11 0.5 2981

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.02 36.13 0.5 2988

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
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Pumped 4% KCL 0,02 36.15 0.5 2951

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 36.23 0.5 2982

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 36.31 0.5 2978

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.07 36.38 0.5 2971

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 36.46 0.5 2951

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 36.54 0.5 2962

Shut down and waited for pressure tobleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 36.62 0.5 2945

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 36.7 0.5 2962

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 36.78 0.5 2967

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 36.86 0.5 2955

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 36.94 0.5 2986

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.1 37.04 0.5 2906

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.09 37.13 0.5 2954

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.1 37.23 0.5 2949

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.09 37.32 0.5 2937

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.1 37.42 0.5 2935

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.1 37.52 0.5 3001

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.1 37.62 0.5 3041

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.1 37.72 0.5 3013

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.11 37.83 0.5 3459

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.16 37.99 0.5 3537

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.16 38.15 0.5 3502
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Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 38.23 0.5 3513
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.07 38.3 0.5 3522
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.07 38.37 0.5 3503
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.07 38.44 0.5 3530
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.07 38.51 0.5 3519
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.07 38.58 0.5 3521
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.07 38.65 0.5 3484
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.07 38.72 0.5 3510
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 38.8 0.5 3484
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.07 38.87 0.5 3517
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 38.95 0.5 3501
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.12 39.07 0.5 3517
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.52 39.59 0.5 3460
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 40.71 80.3 0.8 3446
General details Pressure
ISIP 3240 psi
5 Min 0 psi
Max Treating Pressure 3537 psi
Max Acid Rate 0.8 bpm
Avg Treating Pressure 3295 psi
Load to Recover 82.3 bbis
Note: See 6-4 Acid stim 1 second data tab for details

RD and released acid equipment, RU swab equipment and swabbed well as follows:

Swab runs - 17

Water cut - 10%
Average rate - 300 bfpd

Average fluid level - 3600

Total fluid recovered - 93 bbis

Perf intervals open -6973'-6982'
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See 6-4 Swab report for details.

6/5/2012 Opened well, 50 psi tubing,oil at surface. RU swab equipment, opened bypass on packer, made twoswab

runs to recover oil from tubing.RD swab equipment, released plug and packer and pulled out of hole with

tubing.RUwireline unit and perforated well as follows:
Perf interval - 6926'-694T

Owen Part # SDP-3125-411NT4

.37 entry hole

25 gram charges
42.90" penetration (35.6" thru4 1/2" liner and 7" casing string)
4" EXP gun loaded 6 spf on 60° phasing.

RD and released wireline unit, picked up and trippedin hole with bridge plug, retrieving head, 1 joint2 3/8"

tubing,packer, 68 joints 2 3/8" tubing,xo, 4' sub, cup type SN and 2 7/8" tubingto surface. Set plug at 6961,

set packer at 6867' with EOT at 6903'. RU pump lines, pressure tested packer to 1000 psi, RD pump lines.

SWIFN, Plan to swab for rate and clean up.

6/6/2012 Opened well, 0 psi. RU swab equipment and made 4 swab runs with no entry. RU pump lines and loaded

tubingwith 4% KCL water then pressured up to 1500 psi with an approximate pressure bleed offof 400 psi in

twominutes. Bled off pressure, RD pump lines, reset plug at 6999' and packer at 6867'. RU swab equipment

and swabbed well as follows:

Swab runs - 21

Water cut - 3%

Average rate - 517 bfpd

Average fluid level - 3600

Total fluid recovered - 123 bbis

Perf intervals open -6973'-6982' & 6926'-6947'

See 6-6 Swab report for details.

Leftwell open to frac tank overnight.
6/7/2012 Well flowed back 100 bbls overnight. Reset packer at 6867', reset plug at 6961', RU Halliburton acid equipment

and pumped acid job as follows:
Detail Bbis Cumm Max Max

BPM PSI

Pumped CF to fill tubing 9.68 9.68 2 0

Opened bypass on packer ~ ~ ~ ~

Spotted 7 1/2% FE HCL 21.77 21.77 2 355

Spotted 4% KCL 21.39 43.16 2 260

Closed bypass on packer ~ ~ ~

Pumped 7 1/2% FE HCL 0.18 43.34 0.5 1257

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.07 43.41 0.5 1005

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 43.49 0.5 975

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 43.57 0.5 1026

Shut down and waitedfor pressure tobleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.09 43.66 0.5 1075
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Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.09 43.75 0.5 1086

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.07 43.82 0.5 992

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.06 43.88 0.5 978

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.15 44.03 0.5 1468

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.07 44.1 0.5 1453

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 44.18 0.5 1485

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.09 44.27 0.5 1421

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.07 44.34 0.5 1472

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 44.42 0.5 1475

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.09 44.51 0.5 1459

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.06 44.57 0.5 1448

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.07 44.64 0.5 1447

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.06 44.7 0.5 1453

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 44.78 0.5 1458

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.07 44.85 0.5 1484

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.07 44.92 0.5 1496

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 45 0.5 1552

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.06 45.06 0.5 1397

Shut down and waited for pressure tobleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 45.14 0.5 1501

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.07 45.21 0.5 1498

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.07 45.28 0.5 1472

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
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Pumped 4% KCL 0.07 45.35 0.5 1489 '

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 45.43 0.5 1495

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.06 45.49 0.5 1453

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 45.57 0.5 1495

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.07 45.64 0.5 1500

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 45.72 0.5 1517

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.07 45.79 0.5 1501

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 45.87 0.5 1485

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.07 45.94 0.5 1492

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 46.02 0.5 1487

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.12 46.14 0.5 1478

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.12 46.26 0.5 1471

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.12 46.38 0.5 1493

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.12 46.5 0.5 1484

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.11 46.61 0.5 1453

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.12 46.73 0.5 1469

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.08 46.81 0.5 1425

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.13 46.94 0.5 1505

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.1 47.04 0.5 1495

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.1 47.14 0.5 1493

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.11 47.25 0.5 1491

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.1 47.35 0.5 1486

Page 10 of 14 Daily



Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.14 47.49 0.5 1943
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.18 47.67 0.5 1912
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.1 47.77 0.5 1931
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.12 47.89 0.5 1997
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.1 47.99 0.5 1964
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.12 48.11 0.5 1980

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.11 48.22 0.5 1987

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.06 48.28 0.5 1995
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.19 48.47 0.5 2312

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.17 48.64 0.5 2463
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.13 48.77 0.5 2495
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.12 48.89 0.5 2490
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.12 49.01 0.5 2503

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.12 49.13 0.5 2487

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.12 49.25 0.5 2480

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.12 49.37 0.5 2512

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.09 49.46 0.5 2493

Shut down and waited for pressure tobleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.13 49.59 0.5 2496

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.11 49.7 0.5 2486

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.11 49.81 0.5 2489

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.11 49.92 0.5 2485

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
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Pumped 4% KCL 0.11 50.03 0.5 2481 '

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.22 50.25 0.5 2951

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.23 50.48 0.5 2982

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.14 50.62 0.5 2975

Shut down and waitedfor pressure tobleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.14 50.76 0.5 2982

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.14 50.9 0.5 2975

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.14 51.04 0.8 2980

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.31 51.35 0.5 2952

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.15 51.5 0.5 2969

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.25 51.75 0.5 2951
Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 0.25 52 0.5 2986

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.35 52.35 0.5 2926

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off

Pumped 4% KCL 0.47 52.82 0.5 2983

Shut down and waited for pressure to bleed off
Pumped 4% KCL 8.23 61.05 0.5 3250

Shut down stage 1, loaded balls for stage 2

Opened bypass on packer

Spotted 7 1/2% FE HCL 11.9 72.95 2 3517
Spotted 7 1/2% FE HCL with 100 buoyant balls 23.8 96.75 0.5 322

Closed bypass on packer
Pumped 4% KCL 60 156.75 0.5 3468

General details Pressure

ISIP 2960 psi
5 Min 0 psi
Max Treating Pressure 3468 psi
Max Acid Rate 0.6 bpm

Avg Treating Pressure 3425 psi
Load to Recover 77.9 bb\s

Note: See 6-7 Acid stim 1 second data tab for details

RD and released acid equipment, RU swab equipment and swabbed well as follows:

Swab runs - 8
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Water cut - 55%

Average rate - 264 bfpd
Average fluid level - 3600
Total fluidrecovered - 48 bbls
Perf intervals open -6973'-6982'

See 6-7 Swab report for details.
Note: Rates are not accurate, only 7 bb\s of the 80 bbis of the load water have been recovered.
Plan to continue swabbing / perforate 6873'-6898'

6/8/2012 Well flowed 20 bb\s overnight. RU swab equipment and swabbed well as follows.

Swab runs - 14

Water cut - 10%

Average rate - 350 bfpd

Average fluidlevel - 3750
Total fluid recovered - 66 bbls

Perf intervals open -6973'-6982'

See 6-8 Swab report for details.

Opened bypass on packer, made 3 swab runs to recover oil from tubing.Reset plug at 6915', RU pump lines

and pressure tested plug to 2500 psi. RD pump lines and pulled out of hole with tubingand packer. RU

wireline unit and perforated well as follows:

Perf interval - 6873'-6898'

Owen Part#SDP-3125-411NT4

.37 entry hole

25 gram charges

42.90" penetration (35.6" thru4 1/2" liner and 7" casing string)
4" EXP gun loaded 6 spf on 60° phasing.

RD and released wireline unit. Run in hole with tubingand packer, set packer at 6806' with end of tubingat

6843'. Pressure tested packer. SWIFN

Plan to swab perf interval 6873'-6898' for rate and clean up.
6/9/2012 Opened well, 60 psi tubing,0 psi casing. RU swab equipment and swabbed well as follows:

Swab runs - 17

Water cut - 0-10%

Average rate - 440 bfpd
Average fluid level - 3750

Total fluid recovered - 101 bbis

Perf intervals open -6873'-6898'

See 6-9 Swab report for details.

RD swab equipment, moved plug to 6999', set packer at 6806' to swab all perf intervals. RU swab equipment

and swabbed well as follows:

Swab runs - 17

Water cut - 0-10%

Average rate - 650 bfpd

Average fluid level - 3400

Total fluidrecovered - 129 bbis
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Perf intervals open -6873'-6898', 6926'-6947', 6973'-6982'

See 6-9a Swab report for details.

Opened well to frac tank for the night.
Plan to lay down excess 2-7/8" tubing and all of the 2-3/8" tubing to prepare for pump install on Monday.

6/10/2012 Wellflowed 100 bbis of oil overnight. Opened bypass on packer, RU swab equipment and made 2 swab runs
to recover oil from the tubing. RD swab equipment, released retrievable plug and pulled out of hole with tubing,
packer and plug. SWIFN

Plan to install ESP

6/11/2012 Opened well, 0 psi. RU cable spoolers and run in hole with centralizer, Centinel, motor, seal, pump, xo, 2 3/8"

sub, Y-tool, xo, 2 7/8" sub, 1 joint, cup typeSN and 157 jointsto surface. ND BOP's, NU wellhead. RD service
unit and started well into production.

Plan to clean up location.

6/12/2012 08 Hour production, 052 bopd, 119 bwpd, 45 Hz, BHP 956

6/13/2012 24 Hour production, 439 bopd, 002 bwpd, 45 Hz, BHP 913

6/14/2012 24 Hour production, 401 bopd, 003 bwpd, 45 Hz, BHP 917

Supervisor: Tosup6. Rig Operator: Robert Miller
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RECEIVED: Feb. 19, 2013

                           FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-73528 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 WOLVERINE 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 WOLVERINE FED 20-1 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 WOLVERINE GAS & OIL COMPANY OF UTAH, LLC

9. API NUMBER:
 43041300320000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 One Riverfront Plaza 55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI, 49503 616 458-1150  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 COVENANT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0814 FSL 1933 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SESW Section: 17 Township: 23.0S Range: 01.0W Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 SEVIER 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

4 /25 /2013

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  workover

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Wolverine Gas and Oil Co. of Utah, LLC intends to workover the
Wolverine Federal 20-1 in order to both enhance oil production and

reduce excessive water production at the well. Based on a production
log determination of oil and water contributions from existing

perforations, the deepest Navajo perforations are expected to be
isolated with a retainer and cement squeeze. Subsequently, additional
uphole Navajo pay zones will be recompleted. All perforations will then

be acid stimulated before an ESP is run and the well is returned to
production. After work is completed, a report will be submitted that will

summarize the actual work activities performed. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Helene Bardolph 616 458-1150

TITLE
 Engineering Administrative Assistant

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 2 /19 /2013

February 19, 2013

Sundry Number: 34811 API Well Number: 43041300320000Sundry Number: 34811 API Well Number: 43041300320000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-73528

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. WOLVERINE

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well WOLVERINE FED 20-1

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
WOLVERINE GAS & OIL COMPANY OF UTAH, LLC 43041300320000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
One Riverfront Plaza 55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI, 49503 616 458-1150 Exi COVENANT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SEVIER

0814 FSL 1933 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SESW Section: 17 Township: 23.0S Range: 01.0W Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

4/25/2013
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: workover

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Wolverine Gas and Oil Co. of Utah, LLC intends to workover the Accepted by the
Wolverine Federal 20-1 in order to both enhance oil production and utah Division of

reduce excessive water production at the well. Based on a production oil, Gas and Mining

log determination of oil and water contributions from existing Date: February 19, 2013
perforations, the deepest Navajo perforations are expected to be

isolated with a retainer and cement squeeze. Subsequently, additional sy: \ J \ È
uphole Navajo pay zones will be recompleted. All perforations will then

be acid stimulated before an ESP is run and the well is returned to
production. After work is completed, a report will be submitted that will

summarize the actual work activities performed.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Helene Bardolph 616 458-1150 Engineering Administrative Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 2/19/2013

RECEIVED: Feb. 19,



Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(September 2001) OMB No. 1004-0135

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires January 31, 2004
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-73528
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Nameabandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side 7. If unitor CA/Agreement, Name and/or No

1. TypeofWell
Wolverino Fod Exploration Unit

Oil Well Gas Wen Other 8. Well Name and No.
2. Name of Operator Wolverine Federal #20-1

Wolverine Gas and Oil Company of Utah, LLC 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-041-30032-00-00
55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI 49503 (616) 458-1150 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location ofWell (Footage, Sec., T.,R., M., orSurveyDescription) Exploratory
Surface: 814' FSL & 1,933' FWL, SE/SW, Sec 17, T23S, R1W 11. CountyorParish, State
Bottom: 766' FNL &475' FWL, NWINW, Sec 20, T23S, R1W Sevier County, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Acidize Ü Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off
2 Notice of Intent Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

O Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other r
O Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon

O Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined thatthe site is ready for final inspection.)

Wolverine Gas and Oil Co. of Utah, LLC intends to workover the Wolverine Federal 20-1 in order to improve oil production at
the well. After recompleting two uphole pays in the Upper Navajo (from 6684'-6711'), the top three sets of perforations (from
6684'-6744') will be acid stimulated. Three lower sets of perforations (from 6760'-6838') willbe left untreated, due to already
high fluid production and low oil cuts. Subsequently, an ESP willbe re-run to return the well to production. After work is
completed, a report will be submitted summarizing actual work activities performed.

RECEIVED
RECBVED MAR05 2013

MARO8 2013 RichfieldBLM Field Office
14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and conect DIV.0fOtL,Off's MNIING

Name (Printed/Typed)

Ron Meredith Title Senior Production Engineer

Signature Date 03-04-2013

Approved by

SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE ŒF

Date 2..o |1
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency ofthe United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

(Instructions on



Wolverine Gas & Oil Company of Utah, LLC
Wolverine Federal 20-1

Covenant Field

Purpose: Cement Squeeze Lower Perfs, and Add Perfs at the Top of Lower Navajo Pay

PERTINENT INFORMATION

Location: 814' FSL, 1933' FWL (SE, SW)
Section 17, Township 23 South, Range 1 West
Sevier County, Utah

Elevation: 5839' GL, 5856' KB

TD: 7158'

PBTD: 6860' (TOC, on top of a cement retainer)

API No.: 43-041-30032

Casing: 13¾", 61.0# @2440', cemented to surface
9¾", 47.0#, HCP-110, LT&C @6350', cemented w/ 230 sx 50:50 Poz (1.71 yld)
7", 23.0#, HCP-110, LT&C @7157', cemented w/ 190 sx 50:50 Poz (1.23 yld)

Wellhead: Tubing Head Flange - 7-1/16" 5k w/ 2-7/8" EUE top connection

Tubing: 212 jts of 2½", 6.5#, L-80, EUE, 8rd

Prod. Csg Specs: 7", 23.0#, HCP-110, LT&C, 8rd, ID: 6.366" Drift: 6.241"
Collapse: 5,650 psi, Burst: 6,976 psi (80% of8720psQ

Tubing Specs: 2½", 6.5#, N-80, EUE, 8rd, ID: 2.441", Drift: 2.347"
Collapse: 11,160 psi, Burst: 8,456 psi (80% ofl0,570 psp,
Jt Tensile: 115,968 lbs (80% ofl44,960 lbs)

Capacities: 7", 23.0#: 0.03936 bb1s/ft 0.2210 ft*/ft

2½", 6.5# 0.00579 bbls/ft 0.0325 ft'/ft
7" x 2¾" Annulus 0.0313 Bb1s/ft 0.1759 ft*/ft

BH Temperature: 189°F @6400' TVD

Existing Lower Navajo Perforations: (Note: All depths reference the 9/2/05 Halliburton SDL-DSN-GR log.)
6721'- 6744' MD (6285'- 6387' TVD), 23', 138 holes
6760'- 6782' MD (6323'- 6345' TVD), 22', 98 holes
6800'- 6816' MD (6362'- 6378' TVD), 16', 80 holes
6828'- 6838' MD (6390'- 6400' TVD), 10', 50 holes
Mid-Perfs = 6780' MD (6342' TVD), 71' of Perfs (115 Gross Interval) w/ 366 Holes
*Note: All existing Perforations appear to be in communication
Proþosed Lower Navajo Re-Perf Interval:
6684' - 6690' MD (6248' - 6254' TVD), 6', 96 holes
6700' - 6711' MD (6264' - 6275' TVD), 11', 66 holes

(After Perforating) New Mid-Perfs = 6733' MD (6295' TVD), 62' of Perfs (98' Gross Interval) w/ 398 Holes
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Page 2
Wolverine Federal 19-2 Workover Procedure
March 1, 2013

Wolverine Gas & Oil Company of Utah, LLC
Wolverine Federal 20-1

Covenant Field

PROCEDURE

1. MIRUSU. Disconnect flow lines, ND wellhead, and NU BOP.

2. TOH with production string.

3. Run 6¼" bit and csg scraper to PBTD & circ. hole clean.

4. Perforate the Lower Navajo from 6700'-671l' (1l') and from 6684'-6690' (6').
5. TIH and set a 7" RBP ±6,752' and set a 7" stimulation pkr.±6,660'.

6. Acidize the top 3 sets of perforations (6684'-6744') w/±4000 gals acid.

7. Open well and swab back for cleanup. TOH w/ tbg, pkr and RBP.

8. Re-run production string.

9. ND BOP, install wellhead and start up ESP.

10. RDMOSU and put well on production.
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Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(September 2001) OMB No. 1004-0135

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires January 31, 2004

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-73528

Do not use this form for proposals to dri/I or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned we/I. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side
7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. TypeofWell
\Nolverine Fed Exploration Unit

Oil Well O Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name ofOperator Wolverine Federal #20-1
Wolverine Gas and OilCompany of Utah, LLC 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (íncludearea code) 43-041-30032-00-00
55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI 49503 (616) 458-1150 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M.,or Survey Description) Exploratory
Surface: 814' FSL & 1,933' FWL, SE/SW, Sec 17, T23S, R1W 11. Countyor Parish, State

Bottorn: 766' FNL & 475' FWL, NWINW, Sec 20, T23S, R1W Sevier County, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off
Notice of Intent Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

O SubsequentReport CasingRepair New Construction Recomplete Other Work-over

O Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon
O Final Abandonment Notice Convertto Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Wolverine Gas and Oil Co. of Utah, LLC intends to workover the Wolverine Federal 20-1 in order to improve oil production at
the well. After recompleting two uphole pays in the Upper Navajo (from6684'-6711'), the top three sets of perforations (from
6684'-6744') will be acid stimulated. Three lower sets of perforations (from 6760'-6838') will be left untreated, due to already
high fluid production and low oil cuts. Subsequently, an ESP will be re-run to return the well to production. After work is
completed, a report will be submitted summarizing actual work activities performed.

consaa toœsaam

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Ron Meredith Title Senior Production Engineer

Signature Date 03-04-2013

Approved by

CE FOR FEDERAL OR STAT Ee

er Date 2dt i
Conditions of approval, if any, are attacÏÍed.Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operationsthereon. Í G

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C.Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on



WOLVERINE OPERATING COMPANY
of Utah, LLC

Energy Exploration in Partnership with the Environment

RECENED
March 5, 2013

Mr. Stan Andersen .
Fluid Minerals Group, BLM
Richfield Field Office
150 East 900 North
Richfield, UT 84701

Re: Wolverine Federal 20-1

Dear Mr. Andersen,

Enclosed are one original and two copies of the following sundry:
Wolverine Federal 20-1, Notice of Intent

On February 19, 2013, Wolverine submitted a different sundry for the subject well.
Upon further consideration, the decision was made to revise our previous plans for this
well. We are hereby submitting the enclosed sundry with our revised plans.

Ron MeredÏth(Wolverine Production Engineer) did send a copy of this sundry via email
to Leslie Petersoil earlier today (March 5, 2013).

If you have any questions or concerns regarding this sundry, please don't hesitate to
contact me.

Sincerely,

Helene Bardolph
Engineering Administrative Assistant

Enclosures

cc: Mr. John Rogers, UDOGM

One Riverfront Plaza • 55 Campau, N.W • Grand Rapids, MI49503-2616 • 616.458.1150
FAX 616



RECEIVED: May. 09, 2013

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-73528 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 WOLVERINE 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 WOLVERINE FED 20-1 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 WOLVERINE GAS & OIL COMPANY OF UTAH, LLC

9. API NUMBER:
 43041300320000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 One Riverfront Plaza 55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI, 49503 616 458-1150  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 COVENANT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0814 FSL 1933 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SESW Section: 17 Township: 23.0S Range: 01.0W Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 SEVIER 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

5 /4 /2013

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  Workover

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Wolverine completed a workover on the Wolverine Federal #20-1 on
May 4, 2013. New Navajo perforations were added from 6700'-6711'
(11') & 6684'-6690' (6') with 4", 6 spf, casing guns and a wireline unit.
After perforating, a bridgeplug was set at 6752’ and a packer was set

at 6644’. The well’s upper three sets of perforations (6684’-6690’,
6700’-6711’ and 6721’-6744’) were then acidized with 2000 gals of
7½% HCl and two stages (totaling 850 gals) of Halliburton’s Guidon

diverter. Treating pressures ranged from approximately 1300-1500 psi.
After displacing acid and rigging down pumping equipment, the well
was swabbed and the entire load volume was recovered. The well returned to production at 78 BOPD

and984 BWPD. See attached WBD and Daily Reports for additional details. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Helene Bardolph 616 458-1150

TITLE
 Engineering Administrative Assistant

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 5 /9 /2013

May 09, 2013

Sundry Number: 37756 API Well Number: 43041300320000Sundry Number: 37756 API Well Number: 43041300320000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-73528

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. WOLVERINE

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well WOLVERINE FED 20-1

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
WOLVERINE GAS & OIL COMPANY OF UTAH, LLC 43041300320000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
One Riverfront Plaza 55 Campau NW, Grand Rapids, MI, 49503 616 458-1150 Exi COVENANT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SEVIER

0814 FSL 1933 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SESW Section: 17 Township: 23.0S Range: 01.0W Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

5/4/20 13
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Workover

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Wolverine completed a workover on the Wolverine Federal #20-1 on Accepted by the
May 4, 2013. New Navajo perforations were added from 6700'-6711' Utah Division of

(11') & 6684'-6690' (6') with 4", 6 spf, casing guns and a wireline unit. Oil, Gas and Mining

After perforating, a bridgeplug was set at 6752' and a packer was set FOR RECORD ONLY
at 6644'. The well's upper three sets of perforations (6684'-6690', May 09, 2013

6700'-6711' and 6721'-6744') were then acidized with 2000 gals of
7½% HCI and two stages (totaling 850 gals) of Halliburton's Guidon

diverter. Treating pressures ranged from approximately 1300-1500 psi.
After displacing acid and rigging down pumping equipment, the well

was swabbed and the entire load volume was recovered. The well returned to production at 78 BOPD
and984 BWPD. See attached WBD and Daily Reports for additional details.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Helene Bardolph 616 458-1150 Engineering Administrative Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/9/2013

RECEIVED: May. 09,



RECEIVED: May. 09, 2013

Sundry Number: 37756 API Well Number: 43041300320000Sundry Number: 37756 API Well Number: 43041300320000

Covenant Field BHL NWINW, Sec 20 T23S, R1W
Federal 20-1 SHL SE/SW Sec 17, T23N, R1W
APl# 43-041-30032 Sevier County, Utah

4/29/2013 MIRUSU, ND wellhead, NU BOP's
4/30/2013 Opened well, 0 psi tubing, 60 psi casing. RU vac truck to the casing, RU cable spoolers and pulled out of the

hole with ESP equipment. PU and TIH with bit and casing scraper to PBTD, RU pump lines and reverse
circulated with 280 bbls of completion fluid, RD pump lines and pulled out of hole laying down bit and casing
scraper. RU wireline unit and perforated the well with 4" gun loaded 6 spf on 60° Phasing from 6700-6711' &
6684-6690'

RD and released wireline unit.
Note: Tagged PBTD with a solid tag at 6860'

5/1/2013 Opened well, 0 psi tubing, 0 psi casing. PU and TlH with plug and HD packer, set plug at 6752', set packer at
6644' with EOT at 6656'. RU Halliburton acid equipment and acidized perf intervals 6684-6690', 6700-6711'
and 6721-6744' with 2000 gals 7 1/2% HCI and two stages of Halliburton's Guidon Diverter (totalling850 gals).
Swab runs - 8

Total fluid recovered - 76 bbls
Perf intervals open -6684-6690, 6700-6711, 6721-6744

5/2/2013 Opened well, 0 psi tubing, 0 psi casing. RU swab equipment and swabbed well as follows:
Swab runs - 25

Total fluid recovered - 341 bbls
Perf intervals open -6684-6690, 6700-6711, 6721-6744

RD swab equipment, released packer and plug then rest the plug at 6858' and the packer at 6753' to swab
the bottom 3 perf sets as follows:
Swab runs - 6

Total fluid recovered - 64 bbls
Perf intervals open -6760-6782', 6800-6816', 6828-6838'

RD swab equipment and SWIFN
5/3/2013 Opened well, 0 psi tubing, 0 psi casing. RU swab equipment and swabbed well as follows:

Swab runs - 20

Total fluid recovered - 212 bbls
Perf intervals open -6760-6782', 6800-6816', 6828-6838'

RD swab equipment, released packer and plug then pulled out of the hole with tubing.
5/4/2013 Opened well, 0 psi tubing,0 psi casing. RU cable spooling equipment, PU and run in hole with Centralizer,

Centinel, motor, seal, pump, 10' x 2-¾" tubing sub, Y-tool, 2' x 2-½" tubingsub, 2 joints L-80 tubing, cup type
SN and 205 joints of L-80 tubingto surface. Made final cable splice, ND BOP's, NU wellhead and turnedwell
into production.

Note: Installed all new 316 stainless steel wellhead piping. The internally coated piping that was installed on
the wellhead was bubbled and pulling away from the pipe.

Page 1 of 2 Daily



RECEIVED: May. 09, 2013

Sundry Number: 37756 API Well Number: 43041300320000Sundry Number: 37756 API Well Number: 43041300320000

Supervisor: 744«,E. Rig Operator:
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RECEIVED: May. 09, 2013

Sundry Number: 37756 API Well Number: 43041300320000Sundry Number: 37756 API Well Number: 43041300320000

Wolverine Federal 20-1
API # 43-041-30032

Covenant Field
Section 17, T23S, R1W

Sevier County, Utah

Ground Elevation: 5,839'
KB Elevation: 5,856'

Devigted Well
120 Surface: 814' FSL 1933' FWL, SE SW, 17-23S-1W

Top of Pay (6467' MD): 563' FNL, 681' FWL, NW NW, 20-23S-1W
Total Depth (7158' MD): 766' FNL, 475' FWL, NW NW, 20-23S-1W

Condµctor Casing (08/05)
Size: 20", 0.25" wall

2440 -- Depth Landed: 120'
Cement Data: Cemented to surface with 675 sks G
Sµrface Casinq (8/16/05)
Size/Wt/Grade: 13 3/8", 61#, J-55, STC, 8rd
Depth Landed: 2440' MD
Cement Data: 655 sks CBM light (10.5 ppg, 4.12 cf/sk), 475 sks Type V
(15.6 ppg, 1.18 cf/sk), Cemented to surface

TOC 5510 Intermedigte Casinq (8/29/05)
Size/Wt/Grade: 9-5/8", 47#, HCP-110, LTC, 8rd
Depth Landed: 6350' MD
Cement Data: 230 sks 50:50 Poz, 13.0 ppg, 1.71 cf/sk

Production Casing (9/4/05)
Size/Wt/Grade: 7", 23#, HCP-110, LTC, 8rd
Properties: 8720 psi burst, 6.241" drift, 6.366" ID, 0.0393 Bbl/ftCapacityesso Depth Landed: 7157' MD
Cement Data: 190 sks 50:50 Poz, 14.4 ppg, 1.23 cf/sk

SN 6331
Navajo Perferations
6684-6690' MD (6248-6254' WD), 06', 036 holes (04/30/13)

6397 6700-6711' MD(6264-6275' TVD), 11', 066 holes (04/30/13)
6721-6744' MD (6285-6307' TVD), 23', 138 holes (06/21/10)
6760-6782' MD(6323-6345' TVD), 22', 098 holes (12/10/05)PI 6471
6800-6816' MD (6362-6378' TVD), 16', 080 holes (12/10/05)
6828-6838' MD(6390-6400' TVD), 10', 050 holes (12/10/05)

6497
Mid-Perf = 6761' MD (6324" TVD), 88' M, 468 holes

Note: No cement isolation between any perforation intervals.

Tubinq (05/04/13)6684-6838 SN 6331' MD, (5902' TVD)
Y-tool fish 6397' MD, (5966' TVD)
ESP Intake 6471' MD, (6039' TVD)
End of BHA 6497' MD, (6064' TVD)Csg hole

6884'
PBTD
(04/30/13)Tagged solid at 6860' WLM
(06/17/10)Set CICR 6870' MD - TOC @6860'
(12/08/05) CBL pick-up @7090' MD

---7158' TD (03/22/06)Tubing tagged hard fill@7070' MD
(11/10/06) Tubing tagged fill@ 7076' MD-WLM

TEC



RECEIVED: May. 09, 2013

Sundry Number: 37756 API Well Number: 43041300320000Sundry Number: 37756 API Well Number: 43041300320000

Wolverine Federal 20-1
API # 43-041-30032

Covenant Field
Section 17, T23S, R1W

Sevier County, Utah
Tubing Detail (05/04/13)

17.00 KB
-3.00 Landed above GL
-8.00 Wireline correction

205 6325.17 Tubing -2-7/8", 6.5#, L-80, EUE, 8rd
1 1.31 SN -2-7/8", EUE, 8rd, 2.25" ID
2 62.08 Tubing - 2-7/8", 6.5#, L-80, EUE, 8rd
1 2.10 Tubing - 2-7/8", 6.5#, L-80, EUE, 8rd
1 0.80 X-over - 2-3/8" x 2-7/8", EUE, 8rd
1 2.53 Y-Tool, Weatherford 2-3/8" 1.31" OD (1.053" drift)
1 10.01 Sub - 2-3/8", 4.7#, N-80, EUE, 8rd
1 0.80 X-over - 2-3/8" x 2-7/8", EUE, 8rd
1 0.53 Discharge
1 11.55 Pump
1 23.50 Pump
1 23.50 Pump
1 0.88 Intake
1 6.10 Seal
1 17.00 Motor
1 1.08 Downhole pressure sensor, Centinel
1 .80

X-over 2 3/8" x 2 7/8"
1__ 1.33 Centralizer

6497.07' End of BHA(6064' TVD)

Note: No check or drain valve in thiswell.
Blanking plug in Y-Tool has a 5/8" OD catch rod
Tubing capacity = 0.00579 Bbl/ft,Burst = 10570 psi, Joint Yield = 144960 lbs

Directional Data:

MD TVD Incl. MD TVD Incl.
500 500 1.2 3500 3336 28.4
750 750 3.5 4000 3786 25.9

1000 999 7.0 4500 4232 26.4
1500 1491 11.4 5000 4676 28.2
1750 1736 11.3 5500 5119 24.6
2000 1979 16.6 6000 5584 18.2
2250 2216 20.0 6500 6067 11.3
2500 2449 22.8 7000 6559 10.3
2750 2677 27.0 7178 6714 10.5
3000 2897 28.2

Wellhead Information
- Tubing head flange is 7-1/16", SMwith a 2-7/8" EUE 8rd top connection

Stimulation
12/15/05 6760'- 6838' w/ 5000 gal 15% HCl. Attempted to isolate and treat individual zones.

Communicated between all three perforation intervals. BDP - 4000 psi, ISIP - 3400 psi
06/19/10 6760' - 6816' w/ 3800 gal 15% HCl. No breakdown, ISIP - 2570 psi
05/01/13 6684' - 6744' w/ 2000 gal 7½% HCL with 2 gpt HAl-404Mcorrosion inhibitor, 5 gpt AS-5 anti-

sludge, and 5 gpt Pen-88M penetrating agent. Diverting Agent was 850 gallons Guidon-AGS
with 3 gpt Losurf-300D Max pump psi - 1500, ISIP - 1419

agtes
Surface Location: Latitude = 38.78729, Longitude = -111.93382

(12/07/05) Cement top at 5514' on CBL-CCL-GR
(11/02/06): Available Logs: HRI, SDL/DSN, MRIL,EMI, CBL

TEC
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