
CONFIDENTÊL STATE OF UTAH FORM 3

OGHTHElLT DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISlONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING AMENDEDREPORT

(highlightchanges)

5. MINERALLEASENO: 6.SURFACE:
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL UTU-76335 Federal

1A.TYPEOFWORK: DRILL REENTER DEEPEN
7.lFlNDlAN.ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

8.UNŒorCAAGREEMENTNAME:
B. TYPE OF WELL: OIL GAS OTHER SINGLE ZONE MULTIPLE ZONE Middle Mesa Unit

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

EnCana Oil& Gas (USA) Inc. Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WLDCAT:

370 17th St, Suite 1700 a y Denver CO 80202 (720) 876-5339 South Pine Ridge
4. LOCATIONOF WELL(FOOTAGES) 11.MERR/QTAR,SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

ATSURFACE: 1873' FSL & 1795' FEL
$6 NWSE 31 29S 25E S

AT PROPOSED PRODUCINGZONE:

14. DISTANCEIN MlLESAND DIRECTIONFROM NEARESTTOWN OR POSTOFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:

5.6 Miles Southeast of La Sal, Utah San Juan
UTAH

15. D]STANCETO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE(FEET) 16. NUMBEROFACRES INLEASE: 17. NJMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THlS WELL:

815' 160 40
18. DISTANCETO NEAREST WELL(DRILUNG,COMPLETED,OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:

APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE(FEET)

1723' 6,534 RLBOOO1191
21. ELEVATIONS(SHOWWHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC,): 22. APPROXIMATEDATEWORK WILLSTART: 23. ESTlMATEDDURATION:

6662.9' GR 6/1/2009 30 Days

24. PROPOSED CASINGAND CEMENTINGPROGRAM

SIZE OF HOLE CASINGSIZE, GRADE,AND WEIGHTPER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENTTYPE, QUANTlTY,YIELD,ANDSLURRYWEIGHT

12 1/4 9 5/8 J-55 36# 2,700 Class G + 2% gel 750sx 2.09 cuft/sx 12.5#

8 3/4 5 1/2 I-80 17# 6,534 Class G 50/50 Poz 1000sx 1.43 cuft/sx 13#

25. ATTACHMENTS

VERIFYTHE FOLLOWINGARE ATTACHEDINACCORDANCEWITH THE UTAHOILANDGAS CONSERVATIONGENERAL RULES:

WELL PLATOR MAPPREPARED BYLICENSEDSURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DR]LLINGPLAN

EVlDENCE OF DIVISIONOF WATER RIGHTSAPPROVAL FOR USEOF WATER FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANYOTHER THANTHE LEASEOWNER

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) Jevin Croteau TITLE Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)
Approved by the
Utah Divisionof

API NUMBERASSIGNED: dÍTB Oil,Gaq pgJLMining RECENED
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tate of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Division of Water Rights

30N M. HUNTSMAN,JR. MíCHAELR, STYLER JERRYD.OLDS
. Gr>vernor Executive Director State Engineer/Divuion Director

GARY RÆERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

ORDER OF THE STATE ENGINEER
For Temporary Change Application Number 05-6 (t34402)

Temporary Change Application Number 05-6 (t34402)in the name of Charles Hardison Redd
was filed on May 5, 2008, to change thepoint of diversion, place of use and change the nature of
use of 20,00 acre-feet (af) of water as evidenced by Water Right Number 05-6. Heretofore, the
water has been diverted firoma surface source located North 3,420 feet and West 2,851 feet from
the SE Cornerof Sectîon7, T28S, R25E,SLB&M. The water has been used for the irrigation of
5,00 acres from April 1 to October 31. The water was used in an or portion(s) of Section 35,
T28S, R25E, SLB&M; Section2 and 11, T29S, R24E, SLB&M.

Hereafter, it is proposedto divert 20.00 acre-feet of water fmm surface source located North 712
feet and East 627 feet from the SW Corner of Section 8, T28S,R25E, SLB&M. The water is to
be used for drilling work for oil and gas weHs and road construction and maintenance. The
place of use of the water is being changed to all or portion(s) of Sections 2,8, 11, 14 and 27,
T29S, R24E, SLB&M; Section 8, T29S, R26E, SLB&M and Sections 4, 9, 10, 14 and 15, T30S,
R25E, SLB&M.

Notice of this temporary change application was not publishedina newspaper. It is the opinion
of the State Engineer that it meets the criteria of Section 73-3-3 of the Utah Code for the
approval of temporarychange applications.

It is the opinion of the State Engineer that this change application can be approved without
adversely affecting existing rights. The applicant is put on notice that diligence must be shown
in pursuing the developmentof this application which can be demonstrated by the completion of
the project as proposed in the change application.

It is, therefore, ORDERED and Temporary ChangeApplication Number 05-6 (t34402) is hereby
APPROVED subject to prior rights.

This temporary change application shall expire one year from the date hereof.

It is the applicant's responsibility to maintain a current address with this office and to
update ownership of theirwater right. Pleasenotifythis office immediately of any change
of address or for assistance in updating ownership.

Inasmuch as this application proposes to divert water from a surface source, the applicant is
required to contact the Stream Alteration Sectionof the Division of Water Rights at 801-538-
7240 to obtain a Stream Altemtion permit in addition to this Temporary Change Ápplication.

i s94Wes:North Temple, Suite 220, PO Box 146300, Sah Lake Cùy,UT 84114-6300
elephone (30 538 840 •facsimne {801)538 7467 •
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O O
ORDER OF THE STATE ENGINEER
Temporary Change Application Nurnber
05-6 (t34402)
Page 2

Your contact with this office, should you need it, is with the SoutheasternRegionalOffice. The
telephone number is 435-613-3750.

This Order is subject to the provisions oî Administrative Rule R655-6-17 of the Division of
Water Rights and to Sections6346b-l3 and 73-3-14 of the Utah Code which provide for filing
either a Request for Reconsideration with the State Engineer or an appeal with the appropriate
District Court. A Request for Reconsideration must be filed with the State Engineer within 20
days of the date of this Order. However, a Request for Reconsideration is not a prereqmsite to
filing a court appeal. A court appeal must be filedwithin 30 days after the date of this Order, or
if a Request for Reconsideration has been filed, within 30 days after the date the Request for
Reconsideration is denied. A Request for Reconsideration is considered denied when no action
is taken 20 days after the Request is filed.

Dated this 9 day of sia , 2008.

arc St n P.E , Regional Engineer

Mailed a copy of the foregoingOrderthis ci day of , 2008 to:

Charles Hardison Redd
P.O.Box 278
La Sa1UT 84530

BY:
Kelly K. Horne, Applications/Records
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ONSHORE ORDER No. 1
EnCana Oil & Gas (USA), Inc.
Middle Mesa Fed31-33-29-25 Lease No.UTU-76335
1873' FSL & 1795' FEL (surface)
Section 31-T29S-R25E
1873' FSL & 1795' FEL (bottom hole) Drilling Program
Section 31-T29S-R25E Page 1
San Juan County, Utah

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1

Approval of Operations on Onshore

Federal and indian Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations willbe conducted in such a manner thatfullcompliance is made with
applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, and the approved
plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy of
these conditions will be furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

1. FORMATION TOPS

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth (TVD) Subsea

Burro Canyon Surface 6663

Entrada 1122 5561

Navajo 1385 5298

Kayenta 1922 4761

Wingate 2138 4545

Chinie 2445 4238

Cutler 2753 3930

Honaker Trail 4552 2131

La Sal 5958 725

La Sal Shale 6299 384

Hatch 6384 299

TD 6534 149

2. ANTICIPATED DEPTH OF WATER, OIL& GAS

The estimated depths at which the topand bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas or other
mineral bearing formations as expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation Depth (TVD)

Gas Honaker Trail 4552

Gas La Sal 5958

Gas La Sal Shale
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1873' FSL & 1795' FEL (surface)
Section 31-T29S-R25E
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Section 31-T29S-R25E Page 2
San Juan County, Utah

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling, will be
recorded by depth and adequately protected. Allindications of usable water (10,000 ppm or
less TDS) shall be reported to the Durango Field Office prior to running the next string of
casing or before plugging orders are requested, whichever occurs first.

Ifnoticeable water flows are detected, samples willbe submitted to the BLMalong with any
water analyses conducted.

3. BOP EQUIPMENTIREQUIREMENTS

EnCana Oil & Gas (USA), Inc.'s minimum specificationfor pressure control equipment are
as follows:

Ram Type: 11" Hydraulic double ram with annular, 3000 psi w.p.

Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved stack working
pressure if isolated by test plug or to70% of internal yield pressure of casing. Pressure shall
be maintained for at least 10 minutes or until requirements of test are met, whichever is
longer. Ifa test plug is utilized, no bleed-off pressure is acceptable. For a test not utilizinga
test plug, if a decline in pressure of more than 10% in30 minutes occurs, the test shall be
considered to have failed. Valve on casing head below test plug shall be open during test of
BOP stack.

Annular typepreventers (ifused) shall be tested to 50% of rated working pressure. Pressure
shall be maintained at least 10 minutes or until provisions of test are met, whichever is
longer.

As a minimum, the above test shall beperformed:

a. when initially installed:

b. whenever any seal subject to test pressure is brd<en

c. following related repairs: and

d. at 30 day intervals

Valves shall be tested from working pressure side during BOPE tests with all down stream
valves open.

When testing the kili\\ne valve(s) shall be held open or the ball removed.

Annular preventers (ifused) shall be functionally operated at least weekly.
Pipe and blind rams shall be activated each trip, however, this function need not be
performed more than once a day.

A BOPE pit level drill shall be conducted weekly for each drilling crew.

The BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimum requirements of Onshore Oiland
Gas Order No. 2 for equipment and testing requirements, procedures, etc., and individual
components shall be operable as designed. Chart recorders shall be used for all pressure
tests. Pressure tests shall apply to all related well control
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BOP systems shall be consistent with API RP53. Pressure tests will be conducted before
drilling out from under casing strings which have been set and cemented in place. Blowout
preventer controls willbe installed prior to drilling the surface casing plug and will remain in
use until the well is completed or abandoned. Preventers willbe inspected and operated at
least daily to ensure good mechanical working order, and thisinspection willbe recorded on
the daily drilling report. Preventers will be pressure tested before drilling casing cement
plugs.

The BLM in Moab, Utah shall be notified, at least 24 hours prior to initiating the pressure
test, in order to have a BLM representative on location during pressure testing.

a. The size and rating of the BOP stack is shown on the attached diagram.

b. A choke line and a killline are to be properly installed. The killline is _n_ot to be used
as a fill-up line.

c. The accumulator system shall have a pressure capacity to provide for repeated
operation of hydraulic preventers.

d. Drillstring safety valve(s), to fit all tools in the drillstring, are to be maintained on the
rig floor while drilling operations are in progress.

4. CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAMS

a. The BLMin Moab, Utah shall be notified at least 24 hours priorto the running and cementing
of all casing strings, in order to have a BLM representative on location while running and
cementing all casing strings.

b. The proposed casing and cementing program shall be conducted as approved to protect
and/or isolate all usable water zones, potentially productive zones, lost circulation zones,
abnormally pressured zones, and any prospectively valuable deposits of minerals. Any
isolating medium other than cement shall receive approval prior to use. The casing setting
depth shall be calculated to position the casing seat opposite a competent formation which
will contain the maximum pressure to which it well be exposed during normal drilling
operations. Determination of casing setting depth shall be based on all relevant factors,
including; presencelabsence of hydrocarbons; fracture gradients; usable water zones;
formation pressures; lost circulation zones; other minerals; or other unusual characteristics.
AIIindications of usable water shall be reported.

c. Casing design shall assume formation pressure gradients of 0.44 to 0.50 psi per foot for
exploratory wells (lacking better data).

d. Casing design shall assume fracture gradients from 0.70 to 1.00 psi per foot for exploratory
wells (lacking better data).

e. Casing collars shall have a minimum clearance of 0.422 inches of all sides in the
hole/casing annulus, with recognition thatvariances can be granted for justifiedexceptions.

f. Allwaiting on cement timesshall be adequate toachieve a minimum of 500 psi compressive
strength at the casing shoe prior to drilling out.

g. All casing except the conductor casing, shall be new or reconditioned and tested

ONSHORE ORDER No. 1
EnCana Oil & Gas (USA), Inc.
Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25 Lease No. UTU-76335
1873' FSL & 1795' FEL (surface)
Section 31-T29S-R25E
1873' FSL & 1795' FEL (bottomhole) Drilling Program
Section 31-T29S-R25E Page 3
San Juan County, Utah

BOP systems shall be consistent with API RP53. Pressure tests will be conducted before
drilling out from under casing strings which have been set and cemented in place. Blowout
preventer controls willbe installed prior to drilling the surface casing plug and will remain in
use until the well is completed or abandoned. Preventers willbe inspected and operated at
least daily to ensure good mechanical working order, and thisinspection willbe recorded on
the daily drilling report. Preventers will be pressure tested before drilling casing cement
plugs.

The BLM in Moab, Utah shall be notified, at least 24 hours prior to initiating the pressure
test, in order to have a BLM representative on location during pressure testing.

a. The size and rating of the BOP stack is shown on the attached diagram.

b. A choke line and a killline are to be properly installed. The killline is _n_ot to be used
as a fill-up line.

c. The accumulator system shall have a pressure capacity to provide for repeated
operation of hydraulic preventers.

d. Drillstring safety valve(s), to fit all tools in the drillstring, are to be maintained on the
rig floor while drilling operations are in progress.

4. CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAMS

a. The BLMin Moab, Utah shall be notified at least 24 hours priorto the running and cementing
of all casing strings, in order to have a BLM representative on location while running and
cementing all casing strings.

b. The proposed casing and cementing program shall be conducted as approved to protect
and/or isolate all usable water zones, potentially productive zones, lost circulation zones,
abnormally pressured zones, and any prospectively valuable deposits of minerals. Any
isolating medium other than cement shall receive approval prior to use. The casing setting
depth shall be calculated to position the casing seat opposite a competent formation which
will contain the maximum pressure to which it well be exposed during normal drilling
operations. Determination of casing setting depth shall be based on all relevant factors,
including; presencelabsence of hydrocarbons; fracture gradients; usable water zones;
formation pressures; lost circulation zones; other minerals; or other unusual characteristics.
AIIindications of usable water shall be reported.

c. Casing design shall assume formation pressure gradients of 0.44 to 0.50 psi per foot for
exploratory wells (lacking better data).

d. Casing design shall assume fracture gradients from 0.70 to 1.00 psi per foot for exploratory
wells (lacking better data).

e. Casing collars shall have a minimum clearance of 0.422 inches of all sides in the
hole/casing annulus, with recognition thatvariances can be granted for justifiedexceptions.

f. Allwaiting on cement timesshall be adequate toachieve a minimum of 500 psi compressive
strength at the casing shoe prior to drilling out.

g. All casing except the conductor casing, shall be new or reconditioned and tested



ONSHORE ORDER No. I
EnCana Oil & Gas (USA) Inc.
Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25 Lease No. UTU-76335
1873' FSL & 1795' FEL (surface)
Section 31-T29S-R2SE
1873' FSL & 1795' FEL (bottom hole) Drilling Program
Section 31-T29S-R25E Page 4
San Juan County, Utah

casing that meets or exceeds API standards for new casing.

h. The surface casing shall be cemented back to surface either during the primary cement job
or by remedial cementing.

i. All indication of usable water shall be reported to the authorized officer prior to running the
next string of casing or before plugging orders are requested, whichever occurs first.

j. Surface casing shall have centralizers on the bottom 3 joint of casing (a minimum of one
centralizer per joint starting with the shoe joint).

k. Top plugs shall be used to reduce contamination of cement by displacement fluid.A bottom
plug or other acceptable technique,such as a suitable preflush fluid, inner string cement
method, etc. shall be utilized to help isolate the cement from contamination by the mud fluid
being displaced ahead of the cement slurry.

L Allcasing strings below the conductor sha\\ be pressure tested to 0.22 psi per foot of casing
string length or 1500 psi, whichever is greater, but not to exceed 70% of the minimum
internal yield. Ifpressure declines more than 10% in 30 minutes, corrective actions shall be
taken.

m. On all exploratory wells, and on that portion of any well approved for a SM BOPE system or
greater, a pressure integrity test of each casing shoe shall be performed. Formation at the
shoe shall be tested to minimum of the mud weight equivalent anticipated to control the
formation pressure to the next casing depth or at totaldepth of the well. This test shall be
performed before drilling more than 20 feet of new hole.

n. The proposed casing program will be as follows:

Purpose Depth (MD) Hole O.D. Weight Grade Type NewlUsed
Size

Surface O'-2700' 12-1/4" 9-5/8" 36# J-55 ST&C New

Production O'-6534' 8-3/4" 5-1/2" 17# I-80 LT&C New

o. Casing design subject to revision based on geologic conditions encountered.

p. The cement program will be as follows:

Surface Type and Amount
0-2700' Lead: 550 sx Class G 50/50 Poz + 2% gel, 2.09 cuft/sx

yield, 12.5 ppg
Tail: 200 sx Class G, 1.15 cuft/sx yield, 15.8 ppg

Production Type and Amount

4000'-6534' 1000 sx Class G 50150 Poz, 1.43 cuft/sx yield, 13 ppg

q. The BLMin Moab, Utah should be notified, with sufficient lead time,in order to have a
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representative on location while running all casing strings and cementing.

r. After cementing but before commencing any test, the casing string shall stand cemented
until the cement has reached a compressive strength of at least 500 psi at the shoe. WOC
timeshall be recorded in the drillets log.

s. The following reports shall be filed with the District Manager within 30 days after the work is
completed.

1. Progress reports, Form 3160-5, "Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells", must
include complete information concerning:

i. Setting of each string of casing, showing the size, grade, weight of casing
set, hole size, setting depth, amounts and type of cement used, whether
cement circulated or the top of the cement behind the casing, depth of
cementing tools used, casing test method and results, and the date work was
done. Show the spud date on the first reports submitted.

ii. Temperature or bond logs must be submitted for each well where the casing
cement was not circulated to the surface.

t. Auxiliary equipment to be used is as follows:

1. Kelly cock

2. No bit float is deemed necessary.

3. A sub with a full opening valve.

5. MUD PROGRAM

a. The proposed circulating mediums to be employed in drilling are as follows:

Interval (MD) Mud Type Mud Wt. Visc. FIL
0-4400' Water +/- 8.5 +/- 27 N.C.

4400'-TD LSND +/- 9.0 +/- 40-50 +/- 8

b. Mud monitoring equipment to be used is as follows: Periodic checks of the mud system
will be made each tour. The mud level willbe checked visually.

1. There will be sufficient mud on location to ensure well control.

2. A mud test shall be performed every 24 hours after mudding up to determine, as
applicable: density, viscosity, gel strength, static filtration loss andPh.

c. Hazardous substances specifically listed by the EPA as a hazardous wash or
demonstrating a characteristic of a hazardous waste will not be used in drillingtesting or
completion operations.

6. EVALUATIONPROGRAM - TESTING, LOGGING AND CORING

The anticipated type and amount of testing, logging and coring are as follows:

a. No drillstem tests are anticipated, however, ifDST's are run, the following requirements
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be adhered to:
Initial opening of drill stem test tools shall be restricted to daylight hours unless specific
approval to start during other hours is obtained from the authorized officer. However, DST's
may be allowed to continue at night ifthe test was initiated during daylight hours and the rate
of flow is stabilized and if adequate lighting is available (i.e. lighting which is adequate for
visibilityand vapor-proof for safe operations). Packers can be released, but trippingshall not
begin before daylight, unless prior approval is obtained from the authorized officer. Closed
chamber DST's may be accomplished day or night.

A DST that flows to the surface with evidence of hydrocarbons shall be reversed out of the
testing string under controlled surface conditions. This would involve providing some means
for reverse circulation.

Separation equipment required forthe anticipated recovery shall be properly installed before
a test starts.

AIIengines within100 feet of thewellbore thatare required to "run"during the test shall have
spark arresters or water cooled exhausts.

b. The logging program willbe made up of tworuns. The first willconsist of a GR/AlTINEUT-
DEN w/ PE from TD to base of the surface casing. The second willconsist of a Dipole Sonic
from TD to base of the surface casing.

c. No whole cores are anticipated. Depending upon evaluation of the open hole logs, several
sidewall cores may be obtained in formations of interest.

d. Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well Completion and
Recompletion Report and Log" (Form 3160-4) willbe submitted not later that 30 days after
completion of thewell or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance with
43 CFR 3164. Two copies of all logs, core descriptions, core analyses, well-test data,
geologic summaries, sample description, and all other surveys or data obtained and
compiled during the drilling,work over, and/or completions, will be filed with form 3160-4.
Samples (cuttings, fluids, and/or gases) willbe submitted when requested by the authorized
officer (AO).

e. The anticipated completion program is as follows:

Perforate zones of interest, fracture stimulate as necessary and place on production.

7. ABNORMAL PRESSURES AND H2S GAS

a. The maximum expected bottom hole pressure is2400 psi (pressure gradient of 0.396
psilft). Source of pressure estimate was from data obtained for the La Sal geological
formation in the Middle Mesa State 36-14-29-24 (well is located apprx. 2 miles northwest
of the proposed location).

b. No hydrogen sulfide gas is anticipated; no abnormal pressures or temperatures are
anticipated.

c. As per Onshore Order No. 6, llI.A.2b., if hydrogen sulfide is present the "operator shall
initiallytest the H2S concentration of the gasstream for each wellor production facility

..." Submit the results of thistest within 30 days of filing Form 31604, "Well Completion
or Recompletion Report and
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8. OTHER INFORMATION AND NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

a. The BLM in Moab (435-259-2100) shall be notified at least 24 hours prior to:
1. Spudding the well

2. Running the casing strings and cementing

3. BOP tests/casingpressured tests.
b. Within 30 days of completion of the well as a dry hole or producer, a copy 6 all logs, core

descriptions, core analyses, well-test data, geologic summaries, sample description, and
all other surveys or data obtained and compiled during the drilling, work over, and/or
completions operations will be filed with a Completion Report (Form 3160-4), in triplicate.
Submit casing/cementing reports and other subsequent reports viaSundry Notice Form
3160-5.

c. In accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-3, thiswell shall be reported on MMS Form 3160,
"Monthly Report of Operations", starting with the month in which drilling operations
commence, and continuing each month until the well is physicdly plugged and
abandoned.

d. The date on which production is commenced or resumed will be construed for oil wells
as the date on which liquid hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped from a temporary
storage facility, such as a test tank, and for which a run icket is required to be generated
or, the date on which liquid hydrocarbons are first produced into a permanent storage
facility, whichever first occurs; and, for gas wells as the dateon which associated liquid
hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped froma temporary storage facility, such as a test
tank, and for which a run ticket is required to be generated or the date on which gas is
first measured through permanent metering facilities, whichever first occurs.

e. Pursuant to NTL-4A, lessees or operators are authorized to vent/flare gas during the
initial well evaluation tests, not exceeding a period of 30 days or the production of 50
MMCF of gas, whichever occurs fird. An application must be filed with the District
Engineer and approval received, for any venting/flaring of gas beyond the initial30 day
authorized period.

f. A schematic facilities diagram as required by 43 CFR3162.7-5 (b.9.d), shall be
submitted to the appropriate District Office within 60 days of installation or first
production, whichever occurs first. All site security regulations as specified in Onshore
Order No. 3 shall be adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon
storage tanks willbe effectively sealed in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-5 (b.4).

g. Off-lease measurement and comminglingof production must be approved by the
authorized officer.

h. Section 102(b)(3) of the Federal Oil and Gas Royalty Management Act of 1982, as
implemented by the applicable provisions of the operating regulations at Title 43 CFR
3162.4-1(c), requires that "not later than the 5* business day after any well begins
production on which royalty is due anywhere on a leasesite or allocated to a lease site,
or resumes production in the case of a well which has been off production for more
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90 days, the operator shall notify the authorized officer by letter or sundry notie, Form
3160-5, or orally to be followed by a letter or sundry notice, of the date on which such
production has begun or resumed."

Ifyou fail to comply with this requirement in themanner and time allowed, you shall be
liable for a civil penalty of up to $10,000per violation for each day such violation
continues, not to exceed a maximum of 20 days. See Section 10Rc)(3)of the Federal Oil
and Gas Royalty Management Act of 1982 and be implementing regulations at Title 43
CFR 3162.4-1(b)(5)(ii).

i. The BLMin Moab (435-259-2100) shall be notified within 5 business days of production
start-up if either of the following two conditions occur:

1. The well is placed on production, or
2. The well resumes production after being off of production for more than 90 days.

"Placed on production" means shipment or sales of hydrocarbons from temporary tanks,
production into permanent facilities or measurement through permanent facilities.
Notification may be written or verbalwith written follow-up within 15 days.

j. Drillingis planned to commence upon approval. Completion will begin approximately 30
days after drilling is completed.

k. It is anticipated that the drilling of this well willtake a¡proximately 10-15 days.

I. No location will be constructed or moved, no well will be plugged, and no driling or work
over equipment willbe removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without
prior approval of the AO. Ifoperations are to be sumended, prior approval of the AO will
be obtained and notification given before resumption of operations.

m. Immediate Report: Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents, or any other unusual
occurrences shall be promptly reported in accordance with the requiements of NTL-3A
or its revision.

n. If a replacement rig is contemplated for completion operations, a"Sundry Notice" Form
3160-5 to that effect will be filed, for prior approval of the AO, and all conditions of this
approved plan are applicable during all operations conducted with the replacement rig.

o. Pursuant to Onshore Order No. 7, with the approval of the District Engineer, produced
water may be temporarilydisposed of into unlined pits for a period of up to 90 days.
During the period so authorized, an aplication for approval of the permanent disposal
method, along with the required water analysis and other information, must be submitted
to the District Engineer.

If underground injection is proposed, an EPA or State UIC permit shall also be requied
and submitted to this office.

p. No well abandonment operations will be commenced without the prior approval of the
AO. In the case of newly drilled dry holes or failures, and inemergency situations, oral
approval will be obtained from theAO. A "Subsequent Report of Abandonrnent" Form
3160-5 will be filed with the AO within 30 days following completion of the well for
abandonment. This report will indicate where plugs were placed and the current status of
surface restoration. Final abandonment willnot be approveduntil the surface
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Ifyou fail to comply with this requirement in themanner and time allowed, you shall be
liable for a civil penalty of up to $10,000per violation for each day such violation
continues, not to exceed a maximum of 20 days. See Section 10Rc)(3)of the Federal Oil
and Gas Royalty Management Act of 1982 and be implementing regulations at Title 43
CFR 3162.4-1(b)(5)(ii).
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EnCana Oil & Gas (USA), Inc.
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Section 31-T29S-R25E
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work required by the approved APD or approved abandonment notice has been
completed to the satisfaction of the AO or his representative, or the appropriate Surface
Managing Agency.

q. As per 43 CFR 3162.6, each drilling producing or abandoned well shall be identified with
the operator's name, the lease serial number, the well number, and the surveyed
description of the well (either footages or the quarteFquarter section, the section,
township and range). The Indian lessofs name may also be required. All markings shall
be legible and in a conspicuous place.

r. Bureau of Land Management, Moab Field Office Address and Contacts:

Address: 82 East Dogwood Ave. Phone: 435-259-2100

Moab, Utah 84532

Business Hours: 7:45 a.m. to 4:30 p.m. (Mountain Time), MonFri.

After Hours:

Jack Johnson Engineering Technician 435-259-2129

Eric Jones Petroleum Engineer
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WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 02/11/2009 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-037-31907

WELL NAME: MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25

OPERATOR: ENCANA OIL & GAS (USA) ( N2175 ) PHONE NUMBER: 720-876-5339

CONTACT: JEVIN CROTEAU

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /

NWSE 31 290S 250E .

Tech Review Initials Date
SURFACE: 1873 FSL 1795 FEL

BOTTOM: 1873 FSL 1795 FEL Engineering

COUNTY: SAN JUAN Geology
LATITUDE: 38.23544 LONGITUDE: -109.2050

UTM SURF EASTINGS:657099 NORTHINGS: 4233256 Surface

FIELD NAME: SOUTH PINE RIDGE ( 457 )

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal

LEASE NUMBER: UTU-76335 PROPOSED FORMATION: HATCH

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal COALBED METHANE WELL? NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

Plat R649-2-3.

Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[] Unit: MIDDLE MESA
(No. RLB0001191 )

Potash (Y/N) N/ R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

Water Permit ___ R649-3-3. Exception

(No. 05-6 )
Drilling Unit

RDCC Review (Y/N)
Board Cause No:

(Date: )
Eff Date:

Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

L¢ Intent to Commingle (Y/N) R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:

STIPULATIONS: ) '
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(2/18/2009) Diana Mason - Mid Page 1

United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O.Box45155

SaltLakeCity,Utah84145-0155

INREPLYREFERTO:
3160
(UT-922)

February 17,2009

Mernorandum

To: Assistant Field Office Manager Resources,
Moab Field Office

From: Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer

Subject: 2009 Plan of Development Middle Mesa Unit, San Juan
County, Utah.

Pursuant to email between Diana Whitney, Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, and Mickey
Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land Management, the followingwells are
planned for calendar year 2009 within the Middle Mesa Unit, San Juan County, Utah.

API# WELLNAME LOCATION

(Proposed PZ Hatch)

43-037-31901 Middle Mesa Fed 25-43-29-24 Sec 25 T29S R24E 0759 FSL 2531 FEL
43-037-31902 Middle Mesa Fed 25-41-29-24 Sec 25 T29S R24E 0360 FSL 0960 FWL
43-037-31903 Middle Mesa Fed 25-31-29-24 Sec 25 T29S R24E 2361 FSL 0900 FWL

BHL Sec 25 T29S R24E 2422 FSL 1133 FWL
43-037-31904 Middle Mesa Fed 26-34-29-24 Sec 26 T29S R24E 2011 FSL 0789 FEL

BHL Sec 26 T29S R24E 1961 FSL 0782 FEL
43-037-31905 Middle Mesa Fed 26-23-29-24 Sec 26 T29S R24E 2157 FNL 2036 FEL

BHL Sec 26 T29S R24E 1970 FNL 2057 FEL
43-037-31906 Middle Mesa Fed 31-44-29-25 Sec 31 T29S R25E 0587 FSL 1207 FEL

BHL Sec 31 T29S R25E 0620 FSL 0612 FEL
43-037-31907 Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25 Sec 31 T29S R25E 1873 FSL 1795 FEL
43-037-31908 Middle Mesa Fed 05-08-30-25 Sec 05 T305 R25E 0722 FNL 1034 FEL

This office has no objection to permitting the well at this time.

(s/ MichaelL.Coulthard

bcc: File- Middle Mesa Lhait
Division ofOilGasand Mining
Central Files
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid
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State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OFNATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAELR. STYLER

JON M.HUNTSMAN, JR. ExecutiveDirector

Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GARY R. HERBERT JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Governor Division Director

February 18, 2009

Encana Oil & Gas (USA) Inc.
370 17th St., Ste. 1700
Denver, CO 80202

Re: Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25 Well, 1873' FSL, 1795' FEL, NW SE, Sec. 31,
T. 29 South, R. 25 East, San Juan County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et seq., Utah
Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous
operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date. The API
identification number assigned to this well is 43-037-31907.

Sincerely,

Gil Hunt
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: San Juan County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Moab Office

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 •facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • www.ogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS &
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O O
Operator: Encana Oil & Gas (USA) Inc.

Well Name & Number Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25

API Number: 43-037-31907
Lease: UTU-76335

Location: NW SE Sec. 31 T. 29 South R. 25 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dustin Doucet at (801) 538-5281 (801) 733-0983 home

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Board").
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the
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Form3 60-3 CONFIDENTIAL FORMAPPROVED
(August2007)

UNITED STATES TIGHTHOLE EO 00

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. Lease Serial No.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT UTUf76335
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER 6. If Indian, Allottee or ÏŸibeNamÈ

7. If Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.
la. Type of Work DRILL REENTER Middle Mesa, UTU-82680X

8. Lease Name and Well No.

lb. Type of Well Oil Well Gas Well Other Single Zone g Multiple Zone Mid die Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25

2. NEameornOper r

GCS (USA) Inc.
9. API Wel No

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

370 17th St., Suite 1700, Denver CO 80202 720-876-5339 South Pine Ridge
4. Location of well (Report location clearly and In accordance with any State requirements.*) 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk. And Survey or Area

At surface

1873' FSL& 1795' FEL Sec. 31, T29S-R25E
At proposed prod. zone

14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State

Approximately 5.6 Miles Southeast of La Sal, UT San Juan Utah
15. Distance from proposed* 16. No of Acres in lease 17. Spt cing Unit dedicated to this well

location to nearest

property or lease line, ft 815 ' 160.00 40 acres
(Also to nearest drlg unit line, if any) 1894 '

18. Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/ BIA Bond No, on file
to nearest well, drilling, completed, 1723' 6534 '

TVD UT1005
applied for, on this lease, ft.

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22. Aproximate date work will start* 23. Estimated Duration
6662.9 '

GR 01-Jun-09 30 Days
24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1 shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by existing bond on file
2. A Drilling Plan. (see item 20 above).
3. A Surface Use Plan ( if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the 5. Operator certification.

SUPO must be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office). 6. Such other site specific information and/ or plans as may be required by the
BLM.

25. Signa re Name (Printed/ Typed) Date
Jevin Croteau

Title

R ulatory Analyst
Approved By (Signature) Name (Printed/ Typed) Date

Division of Resources Mcabilöid Ofuce
Application approval does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would

entitle theapplicant to conduct operations thereon.
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department .
or agency ofthe United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction. RECFIVFD1
(Continued on page 2) (Instructions on page 2) J

CONDITIONSOFAPPROVALATTACHgi 1 2010 1

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&
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EnCana Oil & Gas (USA), Inc.
Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Lease UTU-76335
Middle Mesa Unit (UTU-82680-X)
NWISE Section 31, T29S, R25E
San Juan County, Utah

A COMPLETE COPY OF THIS APPROVED PERMIT and Conditions of Approval shall be
maintained on location during all construction and drilling operations, and shall be
available to contractors to ensure compliance.

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

Approval of this application does not warrant or certifythat the applicant holds legal or equitable
titleto those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations
thereon.

Be advised that EnCana Oil & Gas (USA), Inc. is considered to be the operator of the above well
and is responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease for the operations conducted on
the leased lands.

Bond coverage for this well is provided by UT1005 (Principal - EnCana Oil & Gas (USA), Inc.)
via surety consent as provided for in 43 CFR 3104.2.

This officewillhold the aforementioned operator and bond liable untilthe provisions of 43 CFR
3106.7-2 continuing responsibilityare met.

This permit willbe valid for a period of twoyears from the date of approval. An extension of this
permit willbe considered only if a written request is received prior to APD expiration. After
permit termination, a new application must be filed for approval.

All lease operations willbe conducted in full compliance with applicable regulations (43 CFR
3100), Onshore Oil and Gas Orders, lease terms, notices to lessees, and the approved plan of
operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. Failure to
complywith the provisions of this permit, including applicable regulations, stipulations, and/or
approval conditions, willbe considered a violation subject to the enforcement provisions of 43
CFR Subpart
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A. DRILLING PROGRAM

1. The proposed 3M BOP system is adequate for anticipated conditions. Testing to
2M standards is acceptable. Installation, testing and operation of the system
shall be in conformance with Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2.

2. Concurrent approval from the State of Utah, Division of Oil,Gas & Mining
(DOGM) is required before conducting any surface disturbing activities.

3. Drilling reports, which describe the activities of each day, shall be submitted to
the BLM Moab Field Office on a weekly,or more frequent, basis. In addition to a
daily summary of activities, drilling reports shall include the drilling fluid weight,
details of casing and cement, water flows, lost circulationzones and any other
information that would contribute to our understanding of drilling conditions.

4. Submit a Well Completion Report (Form 3160-4) within 30 days of completing the
well. Please invest the necessary energy to thoroughlyand accurately describe
the well
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B. Surface

Site Specific COAs

Middle Mesa Federal 25-43-29-24
1. Due to a raptor nest, no permanent facilities shall be constructedlinstalled on this

location. Facilities shall be located on an adjacent or nearby location.

Middle Mesa Federal 31-11-29-25
1. The operator shall maintain a 50' undisturbed vegetated buffer from the drainage to the

SE corner of the pad.

Middle Mesa Federal 31-22-29-25
1. All earth moving activities associated with construction of the access corridor servicing

the well in T29S R25E Section 31 will be monitored by an archeologist who meets or
exceed the qualification standards recommended by the Secretary of the Interior. The
Bureau has identified this area as containing the potential for buried cultural deposits.

The archeologist shall notify the BLM, Moab Field Office of date they intend to monitor
the aforementioned areas, no less than three days in advance. The BLMwill require the
submission of twocopies of a monitoringreport within30 days of the completion of work.

In the event previously unidentified archaeological materials are identified within the
project area the standard stipulations apply for documentation of archaeological
deposits.

2. This well location is in a geologic formation that has yielded scientificallysignificant
fossils. To minimize the possibility of damaging fossil remains, a paleontological survey
or paleontological monitoringshall be performed.

• A paleontological survey, if conducted, must include the well location and access
road. The survey report must be submitted to the BLM for review prior to
conducting surface disturbing activities (Note: A paleontological survey was
previously conducted on the Middle Mesa No. 5-10 well and access, with
negative findings). Depending on the findings of a paleontological survey,
monitoring may also be needed.

• If a paleontological survey is not conducted, monitoringmust be performed. The
monitor must be on-site during construction of the well pad and access road to
identify any vertebrate paleontological remains that may be uncovered. If a
discovery is made, work must stop in the vicinity of the find. Work may continue
at a distance of 100 feet away from the discovery point. The BLM must be
notified promptly upon discovery of paleontological remains. An assessment of
the discovery will determine its significance, and the actions necessary for
protection.

Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
1. This well location is in a geologic formation that has yielded scientifically significant

fossils. To minimize the possibility of damaging fossil remains, a paleontological survey
or paleontological monitoring shall be performed.

• A paleontological survey, if conducted, must include the well location and access
road. The survey report must be submitted to the BLM for review prior to
conducting surface disturbing activities (Note: A paleontological survey
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previously conducted on the Middle Mesa No. 5-10 well and access, with
negative findings). Depending on the findings of a paleontological survey,
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• If a paleontological survey is not conducted, monitoring must be performed. The
monitor must be on-site during construction of the well pad and access road to
identify any vertebrate paleontological remains that may be uncovered. If a
discovery is made, work must stop in the vicinity of the find. Work may continue
at a distance of 100 feet away from the discovery point. The BLM must be
notified promptly upon discovery of paleontological remains. An assessment of
the discovery will determine its significance, and the actions necessary for
protection.
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Middle Mesa Federal 5-8-30-25
1. This well location is in a geologic formation that has yielded scientifically significant

fossils. To minimize the possibility of damaging fossil remains, a paleontological survey
or paleontological monitoringshall be performed.

• A paleontological survey, if conducted, must include the well location and access
road. The survey report must be submitted to the BLM for review prior to
conducting surface disturbing activities (Note: A paleontological survey was
previously conducted on the Middle Mesa No. 5-10 well and access, with
negative findings). Depending on the findings of a paleontological survey,
monitoringmay also be needed.

• If a paleontological survey is not conducted,monitoringmust be performed. The
monitor must be on-site during construction of the well pad and access road to
identify any vertebrate paleontological remains that may be uncovered. If a
discovery is made, work must stop in the vicinity of the find. Work may continue
at a distance of 100 feet away from the discovery point. The BLM must be
notified promptly upon discovery of paleontological remains. An assessment of
the discovery will determine its significance, and the actions necessary for
protection.

Middle Mesa Federal 5-10-30-25
1. Due to a raptor nest, no permanent facilities shall be constructed/installed on this

location. Facilities shall be located on an adjacent or nearby location.

2. This well location is in a geologic formation that has yielded scientifically significant
fossils. To minimize the possibility of damaging fossil remains, a paleontological survey
or paleontological monitoringshall be performed.
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road. The survey report must be submitted to the BLM for review prior to
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monitoringmay also be needed.

• If a paleontological survey is not conducted, monitoring must be performed. The
monitor must be on-site during construction of the well pad and access road to
identify any vertebrate paleontological remains that may be uncovered. If a
discovery is made, work must stop in the vicinity of the find. Work may continue
at a distance of 100 feet away from the discovery point. The BLM must be
notified promptly upon discovery of paleontological remains. An assessment of
the discovery will determine its significance, and the actions necessary for
protection.

Middle Mesa Federal 4-20-30-25
1. AIIearth moving activities that are associated with the initial construction of the well pad

will be monitored by an archeologist who meets or exceed the qualification standards
recommended by the Secretary of the Interior. The Bureau has identified this area as
containing the potential for buried cultural deposits. Additionally, a temporaryfence will
be erected on the southeast portion of this well pad during constructionto eliminate
damage to a sensitive
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. The archeologist shall notify the BLM, Moab Field Office of date they intend to monitor
the aforementioned areas, no less than three days in advance. The BLMwill require the
submission of two copies of a monitoringreport within 30 days of the completion of work.

In the event previously unidentified archaeological materials are identified within the
project area the standard stipulations apply for documentation of archaeological
deposits.

2. This well location is in a geologic formation that has yielded scientifically significant
fossils. To minimizethe possibility of damaging fossil remains, a paleontological survey
or paleontological monitoring shall be performed.

• A paleontological survey, if conducted, must include the well location and access
road. The survey report must be submitted to the BLM for review prior to
conducting surface disturbing activities (Note: A paleontological survey was
previously conducted on the Middle Mesa No. 5-10 well and access, with
negative findings). Depending on the findings of a paleontological survey,
monitoring may also be needed.

• If a paleontological survey is not conducted, monitoring must be performed. The
monitor must be on-site during construction of the well pad and access road to
identify any vertebrate paleontological remains that may be uncovered. If a
discovery is made, work must stop in the vicinity of the find. Work may continue
at a distance of 100 feet away from the discovery point. The BLM must be
notified promptly upon discovery of paleontological remains. An assessment of
the discovery will determine its significance, and the actions necessary for
protection.

Bull Horn Federal 9-13-30-25
1. This well location is in a geologic formation that has yielded scientifically significant

fossils. To minimizethe possibility of damaging fossil remains, a paleontological survey
or paleontological monitoringshall be performed.

• A paleontological survey, if conducted, must include the well location and access
road. The survey report must be submitted to the BLM for review prior to
conducting surface disturbing activities (Note: A paleontological survey was
previously conducted on the Middle Mesa No. 5-10 well and access, with
negative findings). Depending on the findings of a paleontological survey,
monitoring may also be needed.

• If a paleontological survey is not conducted, monitoringmust be performed. The
monitor must be on-site during construction of the well pad and access road to
identify any vertebrate paleontological remains that may be uncovered. If a
discovery is made, work must stop in the vicinity of the find. Work may continue
at a distance of 100 feet away from the discovery point. The BLM must be
notified promptly upon discovery of paleontological remains. An assessment of
the discovery will determine its significance, and the actions necessary for
protection.

General COAs

Other required approvals
1. This approval does not authorize non-federal actions. State and county permits

may be required prior to any construction
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Cultural
1. Should any cultural resources be unearthed, surface-disturbing activities would be re-

routed to avoid or halted until the cultural sites/artifacts can be evaluated for
significance, and a mitigation/salvageplan be formulated. These actions would
successfully mitigate possible impacts to cultural resources such that detailed analysis is
not required.

Paleontological Resources
1. Paleontological resources are not likely to be encountered, except for those site listed

previously, but could be discovered during construction. Because of this the operator
shall; (1) with contractors, go over procedures for stopping work and notifying BLM if
paleontological resources were found while working on the project, (2) notify the
contractor of his responsibilities for informing employees/sub-contractors of the potential
for prosecution if paleontological resources were disturbed.

Wildlife
1. In order to protect nesting raptors, no road or well pad construction, drilling or well

completion operations, or construction of production facilities will be authorized between
March 1 and August 31. No permanent facilities or construction activities would be
allowed that could cause permanent abandonment of established nest sites if facility or
construction removed a nest or permanently interfered with nesting activity. Most
raptors typicallyrequire a ½ mile buffer except burrowing owls which require a ¾ mile
buffer to protect nest site and nest activity. Raptor surveys would be required during
breeding and nesting season by a qualified biologist. Breeding season surveys must be
updated each year prior to surface disturbing activities. The restriction would reduce
potential impacts to other bird species when the young would be raised. The limitation
does not apply to maintenance and operation of producing wells. Exceptions will be
granted to this limitation and willbe specified in writing by the Moab Field Office.

2. In order to protect mule deer on crucial winter range no road or well pad construction,
drilling or well completion operations, or construction of production facilities will be
authorized between November 15 and April 15 to reduce the potential impacts to mule
deer. The restriction would not apply to the maintenance and operation of producing
wells. The dates and provisions for producing wells would be consistent with the oil and
gas stipulation for deer winter range in the MFO RMP.

Well Pad/Road Construction/Maintenance
1. Allsoil and gravel brought in from offsite for road or pad construction need to come from

a pit free of invasive, non-native species.

2. Impacts from new well pad and road construction would be minimized by appropriate
drainage control (ie. water bars, Iow water crossings in ephemeral drainages, etc). If the
wells go into production, mitigation of impacts to soils would include 1) upgrading roads
to BLM Gold Book standards and 2) reclamation of any unused areas (ie. wellpads,
unneeded road access). If the wells are not produced, then reclamation would mitigate
and reduce impacts to soils.

3. The operator shall maintain the existing roads in a safe, usable condition, as directed by
the Moab Field Office. The maintenance program shall include, but is not limited to,
blading, ditching, installing culverts, and if needed, surfacing the road with rock
materials. The operator shall conduct all activities associated with the San Juan County
roads within the existing surface disturbances of the maintained roads. The
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shall repair all damages to the county roads resulting from traffic associated with
constructing, drilling, and producing the well.

4. The operator shall not block access to roads that intersect with the main roads being
used to drill these wells. If blading the road for maintenance, the operator must make
sure to remove any windrow that crosses another road.

5. The operator shall salvage the topsoilfrom entire disturbed area of the location prior to
construction of the pad. This includes removal of topsoil from the areas where spoil
piles will be stored.

6. Gates and cattle guards shall be maintained to at least existing condition or better.

7. New roads constructed shall be signed Administrative use Only.

Wastes
1. All Federal and State laws would be followed regarding use, storage and disposal of

hazardous materials and solid wastes.

2. No produced water or other fluids will be disposed on the well pad or roads.

Soils/Dust
1. Dust control will be provided during construction and drilling operations by spraying fresh

water on new road construction, roads being maintained or utilized, and the well pad as
needed.

Fuels/Fire
1. During the activities of road maintenance, new road construction, or the

construction of well pads, if any standing live or dead trees were damaged, cut
down, or knocked over by grading or construction equipment; actions would be
taken to mitigate the fuel loads from slash generated from these activities. In
areas where reclamation of the site would be expected and slash would be
utilized to help reclaim the site, temporary piling of slash until terminationof
activities would be acceptable. In areas where reclamation is not planned in the
foreseeable future, disposal of slash would be required.

Acceptable disposal actions include the chipping of materials on site with
dispersal along the road or pad edge. Hauling of materials would also be
acceptable with the following stipulations:

a. BLMwould pre-approve the disposal location.
b. Piled vegetation would not be withinfifteen feet of standing live trees.
c. Because downed trees would provide an opportunity for public firewood

cutting and collection, piles must be located adjacent to and accessible by
road.

d. AIIburning of materials would be conducted by BLM specialists.

Reclamation
1. Drillpads and new roads to non-producingwells will be reclaimed. Reclamation will

include removal of new road and the incorporation of a seed mix that will provide a
vegetation structure as close to the existing plant communityas
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2. At the end of drilling operations and prior to reclamation of the reserve pit, the top of the
pit will be covered with netting of one inch or less to prevent access by birds while the pit
is drying.

3. The pit will not be left open for more than 6 months from the completion of drilling
activities. If necessary the pit fluids will be drained and then closed prior to the 1 year
deadline.

4. Interim reclamation shall be commenced within 6 months of completion of the well.
Interim reclamation will include the reclamation of all the portions of the pad not required
for everyday production.

5. For Interim Reclamation the operator willdrill seed on the contour to a depth of 0.5 inch,
followed by cultipaction to compact the seedbed, preventing soil and seed losses. To
maintain quality and purity, the current years tested, certified seed with a minimum
germination rate of 80% and a minimum purity of 90% will be used. Use the following
seed mix:

Species - Cultivar % in Mix Lbs PLS*

Indian Ricegrass 50 5
Slender wheatgrass 40 4

Four-wing saltbush 40 4

Totals 100% 10.0ÑÑsacre

*PLS
= pure live seed

*Double this rate if broadcast seeding

6. Slopes too steep for machinery may be hand broadcast and raked with twice the
specified amount of seed,

Noxious/Invasive Weeds
1. To reduce the opportunity to transport invasive and/or noxious weeds, the operator will

be required to wash all vehicles and equipment before mobilizing into the project area to
begin any dirt work or drilling activities.

2. The operator will be responsible for weed control on the disturbed areas within the limits
of the well pad and road construction. The operator will be responsible for consultation
with the authorized officerand/or local authorities for acceptable weed control methods.

3. The operator willmonitor for noxious weeds that might move onto the location. If any
are discovered an Integrated Pest Management Plan will be created and need BLM
approval prior to beginning any treatmentprogram.

Air Quality
1. All new and replacement internal combustion oil and gas field engines of less

than or equal to 300 design-rated horsepower must not emit more than 2 grams
of NOx per horsepower-hour. This requirement does not apply to oil and gas field
engines of less than or equal to 40 design-rated
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2. Allnew and replacement internal combustion oil and gas field engines of greater
than 300 design rated horsepower must not emit more than 1.0 gram of NOx per
horsepower-hour.

Other
1. Please contact Ben Kniola, Natural Resource Specialist, @ (435) 259-2127, Bureau of

Land Management, Moab, if there are any questions concerning these surface use
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C. REQUIRED APPROVALS, REPORTS AND NOTIFICATIONS

Required verbal notifications are summarized in Table 1, attached.

Buildinq Location- Contact the BLM, Natural Resource Protection Specialist at least 48-hours
prior to commencing construction of location.

Soud- The spud date willbe reported to BLM24-hours prior to spud. Written notificationin the
form of a Sundry Notice (Form 3160-5) will be submitted to the Moab Field Office within 24-hours
after spud, regardless of whether spud was made with a dry hole digger or big rig.

Daily Drillinq Reports- Daily drilling reports shall detail the progress and status of the well and
shall be submitted to the Moab Field Office on a weekly basis.

Oil and Gas Operations Reports (OGORs)- Production from this well shall be reported to
Minerals Management Service (MMS) on a monthly basis.

Sundry Notices- There will be no deviation from the proposed drilling and/or workover program
without prior approval. "Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells" (Form 3160-5) willbe filed with
the Moab Field Office for approval of all changes of plans and subsequent operations in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.3-2. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed.

DrillinqSuspensions- Operations authorized by this permit shall not be suspended for more than
30 days without prior approval of the Moab Field Office. Allconditions of this approval shall be
applicable during any operations conducted with a replacement rig.

Undesirable Events- Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents, or any other unusual occurrences
shall be immediately reported to the BLMin accordance with requirements of NTL-3A.

Cultural Resources- Ifcultural resources are discovered during construction, work that might
disturb the resources is to stop, and the Moab Field Office is to be notified.

First Production- Should the wellbe successfully completed for production, the Moab Field
Office willbe notified when the well is placed in producing status. Such notification may be made
by phone, but must be followed by a sundry notice or letter not later than five business days
following the date on which the well is placed into production.

A first production conference willbe scheduled as soon as the productivity of the well is
apparent. This conference should be coordinated through the Moab Field Office. The Moab
Field Officeshall be notified prior to the first sale.

Well Completion Report- Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well
Completion and Recompletion Report and Log" (Form 3160-4) will be submitted to the Moab
Field Office not later than thirty-daysafter completion of the well or after completion of
operations being performed, in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-1. Two copies of all logs, core
descriptions, core analyses, well test data, geologic summaries, sample description, and all
other surveys or data obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover, and/or completion
operations, willbe filed with Form 3160-4. When requested, samples (cuttings and/or samples)
willbe submitted to the Moab Field
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VentinqlFlarinq of Gas- Gas produced from this well may not be vented/flared beyond an initial,
authorized test period of 30 days or 50 MMcf,whichever first occurs, without the prior, written
approval of the Moab Field Office. Should gas be vented or flared without approval beyond the
authorized test period, the well may be ordered shut-in until the gas can be captured or approval
to continue the venting/flaring as uneconomic is granted. In such case, compensation to the
lessor (BLM)shall be required for that portion of the gas that is vented/flared without approval
and which is determined to have been avoidably lost.

Produced Water- An application for approval of a permanent disposal method and location will
be submitted to the Moab Field Office for approval pursuant to Onshore Oil and Gas Order No.7.

Off-Lease Measurement, Storage, Comminqlinq- Prior approval must be obtained from the Moab
Field Office for off-lease measurement, off-lease storage and/or commingling(either down-hole
or at the surface).

Pluqqinq and Abandonment- If the well is completed as a dry hole, plugging instructions must be
obtained from the Moab Field Office prior to initiating plugging operations.

A "Subsequent Report of Abandonment" (Form 3160-5) willbe filed with the Moab Field Office
within thirty-daysfollowing completion of the well for abandonment. This report willindicate
where plugs were placed and the current status of surface restoration. Upon completion of
approved plugging, a regulation marker will be erected in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.6. Final
abandonment will not be approved until the surface reclamation work required by the approved
APD or approved abandonment notice has been completed to the satisfaction of the Moab Field
Office or the appropriate surface managing agency.

TABLE 1 NOTIFICATIONS

Notify Ben Kniola (435-259-2127) or Dave Skinner (435-259-2145) BLMMoab Field Office:

2 days prior to commencement of dirt work, construction and reclamation.

Notify Jeff Brown (435-587-1525) BLM Monticello Field Officefor the following:

1 day prior to spud;

50 feet prior to reaching the surface casing setting depth;

3 hours prior to testingBOPE.

Ifthe person at the above number cannot be reached, notify the Moab Field Office at
435-259-2100. If unsuccessful, contact the person listed below.

Well abandonment operations require 24 hour advance notice and prior approval. In the case of
newlydrilled dry holes, verbal approval can be obtained by calling the Moab Field Officeat
435-259-2100. Ifapproval is needed after work hours, you may contactthe following:

Eric Jones, Petroleum Engineer Office: 435-259-2117
Home:
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

D
NEOFoOFILNAGAAR soMIRNEDNFllENTIALWu-E7D6E G3N5ATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTFEEOR TRIBE NAME
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME
Do not use thisform for proposals to drillnew wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to Middle Mesa Unitdrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL O GAS WELL OTHER Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

EnCana Oil & Gas (USA) Inc. 4303731907
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WLDCAT:
370 17th Street, Suite 1700 Denver CO , 80202 (720) 876-5339 South Pine Ridge

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1873' FSL & 1795' FEL COUNTY: San Juan

QTR/QTR, SECTlON, TOWNSHIP,RANGE,MERIDIAN: NWSE 31 29S 25E S STATE:
UTAH

11 CHECKAPPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENTFORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximatedateworkwillstart: CASINGREPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

6/1/2010 CHANŒ TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDOM VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: Request APD
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE-DIFFERENT FORMATlON Extension

12 DESCRI BE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, v olumes, etc.

EnCana Oil & Gas (USA) Inc. is requesting an extension on the approved Application for Permit to Drill for the subject well.
Nothing has changed on the approved application.

Please find the APD Request for Permit Extension Validation Form attached as required.

Approved by the
Utah Divisionof

Oil,Gas and Mining

COPYSENTTOOPERATOR
Date

in ir

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) Jevin Croteau TITLE Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only}

RECEIVED
JAN18 2010

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&
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12 DESCRI BE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, v olumes, etc.

EnCana Oil & Gas (USA) Inc. is requesting an extension on the approved Application for Permit to Drill for the subject well.
Nothing has changed on the approved application.

Please find the APD Request for Permit Extension Validation Form attached as required.

Approved by the
Utah Divisionof

Oil,Gas and Mining

COPYSENTTOOPERATOR
Date

in ir

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) Jevin Croteau TITLE Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only}

RECEIVED
JAN18 2010

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(thisform should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

Well Name: Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25

Location: 1873' FSL & 1795' FEL, Sec. 31, T29S, R25E, SLPM
Company Permit Issued to: EnCana Oil & Gas (USA) Inc.
Date Original Permit Issued: 2/18/2009

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submitted in the previously
approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface
agreement been updated? YesONoO

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinityof the proposed well which would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location? YesO NolZI

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the
permitting or operation of this proposed well? YesO No IZI

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way, which could affect the proposed location? YesO No IZI

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? YesO NolZl

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
which willrequire a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation? YesONolZl

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? YeslZINoO

SigrÑture Date

Title: Regulatory Analyst

Representing: EnCana Oil & Gas (USA) Inc.
RECEIVED
JANt a2010

DIV.0FOlL,GAS&

Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(thisform should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

Well Name: Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25

Location: 1873' FSL & 1795' FEL, Sec. 31, T29S, R25E, SLPM
Company Permit Issued to: EnCana Oil & Gas (USA) Inc.
Date Original Permit Issued: 2/18/2009

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submitted in the previously
approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface
agreement been updated? YesONoO

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinityof the proposed well which would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location? YesO NolZI

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the
permitting or operation of this proposed well? YesO No IZI

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way, which could affect the proposed location? YesO No IZI

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? YesO NolZl

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
which willrequire a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation? YesONolZl

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? YeslZINoO

SigrÑture Date

Title: Regulatory Analyst

Representing: EnCana Oil & Gas (USA) Inc.
RECEIVED
JANt a2010

DIV.0FOlL,GAS&



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 5/14/2010

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2175-EnCana Oil & Gas (USA) Inc. N3670-Patara Oil & Gas, LLC

370 17th Street, Suite 1700 333 Clay Street, Suite 3960
Denver, CO 80202 Houston, TX 77002

Phone: 1 (303) 623-2300 Phone: 1 (713) 357-7171

CA No. Unit: MIDDLE MESA
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

NO TYPE STATUS
SEE ATTACHED

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 5/11/2010
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 5/11/2010
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 5/11/2010
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 7655540-0161
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: * * requested 9/27/10
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: * * requested 9/27/10
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM not yet BIA
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 6/28/2010 & 9/2/2010
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 6/29/2010
Lisbon B-816 only

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 9/14/2010
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 9/14/2010
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 9/14/2010
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 9/14/2010
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 9/14/2010
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: 5/11/2010
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: UTB000428
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: n/a
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number RLB0013207

& BOO6008
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: not yet
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS:

Patara (Middle Mesa) FORM A.xis

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 5/14/2010

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2175-EnCana Oil & Gas (USA) Inc. N3670-Patara Oil & Gas, LLC

370 17th Street, Suite 1700 333 Clay Street, Suite 3960
Denver, CO 80202 Houston, TX 77002

Phone: 1 (303) 623-2300 Phone: 1 (713) 357-7171

CA No. Unit: MIDDLE MESA
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

NO TYPE STATUS
SEE ATTACHED

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 5/11/2010
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 5/11/2010
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 5/11/2010
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 7655540-0161
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: * * requested 9/27/10
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: * * requested 9/27/10
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM not yet BIA
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 6/28/2010 & 9/2/2010
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 6/29/2010
Lisbon B-816 only

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 9/14/2010
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 9/14/2010
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 9/14/2010
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 9/14/2010
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 9/14/2010
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: 5/11/2010
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: UTB000428
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: n/a
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number RLB0013207

& BOO6008
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: not yet
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS:

Patara (Middle Mesa) FORM A.xis



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OlL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do notuse this form for proposals todrillnewwells,significantlydeepen existing wellsbelow current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drillhorizontal laterais. Use APPUCATION FOR PERMITTO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER

8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
ENCANAOIL &GAS (USA) INC.

3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
370 17th Street, Suite 1700 , Denver CO y, 80202 (303) 623-2300

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: See Attached List COUNTY:

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECKAPPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASlNG REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABAIDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER:

CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective May 4, 2010 Patara Oil & Gas LLC, 333 Clay Street, Suite 3960, Houston, TX 77002, will take over completions and
operations and is designated as agent operator for the subject wells on the attached list.

Bond coverage for all vities will be covered by Patara's BLM Statewide Oil & Gas Bond No. UTBOOO428 and UDOGM Bond
No. Pending- ÂÂÛŸ 4 ÛË.)Í»()()Ê
Patara Oil , h . Kinc non, Vice- ent, Land & Business Development ÑSGŸÖ
Signature « , Date 5/4/2010

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Ric D. Gallegos
.... TITLE

Attorney-in-Fact

SIGNATURE *
DATE 5/4/2010

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED / / AD/o RECElVED

(5/2000) e instructions on Reverse Side)
Division of Oil,GasandMining
EarleneRussell, EngineeringTechnician DIV.0F01L,GAS&

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OlL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do notuse this form for proposals todrillnewwells,significantlydeepen existing wellsbelow current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drillhorizontal laterais. Use APPUCATION FOR PERMITTO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER

8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
ENCANAOIL &GAS (USA) INC.

3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
370 17th Street, Suite 1700 , Denver CO y, 80202 (303) 623-2300

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: See Attached List COUNTY:

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECKAPPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASlNG REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABAIDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER:

CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective May 4, 2010 Patara Oil & Gas LLC, 333 Clay Street, Suite 3960, Houston, TX 77002, will take over completions and
operations and is designated as agent operator for the subject wells on the attached list.

Bond coverage for all vities will be covered by Patara's BLM Statewide Oil & Gas Bond No. UTBOOO428 and UDOGM Bond
No. Pending- ÂÂÛŸ 4 ÛË.)Í»()()Ê
Patara Oil , h . Kinc non, Vice- ent, Land & Business Development ÑSGŸÖ
Signature « , Date 5/4/2010

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Ric D. Gallegos
.... TITLE

Attorney-in-Fact

SIGNATURE *
DATE 5/4/2010

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED / / AD/o RECElVED

(5/2000) e instructions on Reverse Side)
Division of Oil,GasandMining
EarleneRussell, EngineeringTechnician DIV.0F01L,GAS&



ENCANAO-G (N2175) to PATARA O-G (N3670)
effective May 4, 2010

MIDDLEMESA

well name sec twp rng api entity lease well stat C
BIG INDIAN 35-24 35 290S 240E 4303731829 14409 Federal GW S
MIDDLE MESA ST 36-14-29-24 36 290S 240E 4303731838 15076 State GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 5-6-30-25 05 300S 250E 4303731853 16375 Federal GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-31-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731854 15721 Federal GW P
MIDDLE MESA ST 36-12-29-24 36 290S 240E 4303731855 16187 State GW P
MIDDLE MESA ST 36-24-29-24 36 290S 240E 4303731856 16186 State GW S
MIDDLE MESA ST 36-12B-29-24 36 290S 240E 4303731877 15076 State GW P
MIDDLE MESA ST 36-24B-29-24 36 290S 240E 4303731878 16834 State GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 30-41-29-25 30 290S 250E 4303731893 Federal GW APD C
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-42-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731895 Federal GW APD C
MIDDLE MESA FED 5-10-30-25 05 300S 250E 4303731897 Federal GW APD
MIDDLE MESA FED 4-20-30-25 04 300S 250E 4303731898 Federal GW APD C
MIDDLE MESA FED 25-43-29-24 25 290S 240E 4303731901 Federal GW APD C
MIDDLE MESA FED 25-31-29-24 25 290S 240E 4303731903 Federal GW APD C
MIDDLE MESA FED 26-34-29-24 26 290S 240E 4303731904 Federal GW APD C
MIDDLE MESA FED 26-23-29-24 26 290S 240E 4303731905 Federal GW APD C
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-44-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731906 Federal GW APD C
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731907 Federal GW APD C
MIDDLE MESA FED 5-8-30-25 05 300S 250E 4303731908 Federal GW APD C
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-22-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731909 Federal GW APD
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-11-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731910 Federal GW APD

**Moved 7/14/2010
MIDDLE MESA FED 25-41-29-24 25 290S 240E 4303731902 Federal GW APD C

1

ENCANAO-G (N2175) to PATARA O-G (N3670)
effective May 4, 2010

MIDDLEMESA

well name sec twp rng api entity lease well stat C
BIG INDIAN 35-24 35 290S 240E 4303731829 14409 Federal GW S
MIDDLE MESA ST 36-14-29-24 36 290S 240E 4303731838 15076 State GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 5-6-30-25 05 300S 250E 4303731853 16375 Federal GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-31-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731854 15721 Federal GW P
MIDDLE MESA ST 36-12-29-24 36 290S 240E 4303731855 16187 State GW P
MIDDLE MESA ST 36-24-29-24 36 290S 240E 4303731856 16186 State GW S
MIDDLE MESA ST 36-12B-29-24 36 290S 240E 4303731877 15076 State GW P
MIDDLE MESA ST 36-24B-29-24 36 290S 240E 4303731878 16834 State GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 30-41-29-25 30 290S 250E 4303731893 Federal GW APD C
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-42-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731895 Federal GW APD C
MIDDLE MESA FED 5-10-30-25 05 300S 250E 4303731897 Federal GW APD
MIDDLE MESA FED 4-20-30-25 04 300S 250E 4303731898 Federal GW APD C
MIDDLE MESA FED 25-43-29-24 25 290S 240E 4303731901 Federal GW APD C
MIDDLE MESA FED 25-31-29-24 25 290S 240E 4303731903 Federal GW APD C
MIDDLE MESA FED 26-34-29-24 26 290S 240E 4303731904 Federal GW APD C
MIDDLE MESA FED 26-23-29-24 26 290S 240E 4303731905 Federal GW APD C
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-44-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731906 Federal GW APD C
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731907 Federal GW APD C
MIDDLE MESA FED 5-8-30-25 05 300S 250E 4303731908 Federal GW APD C
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-22-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731909 Federal GW APD
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-11-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731910 Federal GW APD

**Moved 7/14/2010
MIDDLE MESA FED 25-41-29-24 25 290S 240E 4303731902 Federal GW APD C

1



United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

CH Utah State Office AKE
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
http://www.bim.gov/ut/stlen.html

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
UT-922

June 28, 2010

David M. Laramie
Patara Oil & Gas, LLC
621 17thStreet, Suite 1345
Denver, CO 80293

Re: Successor Operator
Middle Mesa Unit
UTU82680X
San Juan County, Utah

Dear Mr. Laramie:

On June 25, 2010, we received an indenture dated May 4, 2010, whereby EnCana Oil&Gas (USA),
Inc. resigned as Unit Operator and Patara Oil & Gas, LLC was designated as Successor Unit
Operator for the Middle Mesa Unit, San Juan County, Utah. The indenture was executed by both
parties and the signatory parties (working interest owners) have complied with Sections 5 and 6 of
the unit agreement.

The instrument is hereby approved effective June 28, 2010. In approving this designation, the
Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the designated party has obtained all required
approval that would entitle it to conduct operations under the Middle Mesa Unit Agreement.

Your statewide oil and gas BLM Bond No. UTBOOO428will be used to cover unit operations.

It is requested that you notify all interested parties of the change in unit operator. Copies of the
approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriate Federal offices, with one copy
returned herewith.

Ifyou have any questions, contact Leslie Wilcken of this office at (801) 539-4112.

Sincerely,

/s/Roger L. Bankert

Roger L. Bankert
Chief, Branch of Minerals

Enclosure
RECElVED
JULO6 2010

DIVOFOlL,GAS&

United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

CH Utah State Office AKE
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
http://www.bim.gov/ut/stlen.html

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
UT-922

June 28, 2010

David M. Laramie
Patara Oil & Gas, LLC
621 17thStreet, Suite 1345
Denver, CO 80293

Re: Successor Operator
Middle Mesa Unit
UTU82680X
San Juan County, Utah

Dear Mr. Laramie:

On June 25, 2010, we received an indenture dated May 4, 2010, whereby EnCana Oil&Gas (USA),
Inc. resigned as Unit Operator and Patara Oil & Gas, LLC was designated as Successor Unit
Operator for the Middle Mesa Unit, San Juan County, Utah. The indenture was executed by both
parties and the signatory parties (working interest owners) have complied with Sections 5 and 6 of
the unit agreement.

The instrument is hereby approved effective June 28, 2010. In approving this designation, the
Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the designated party has obtained all required
approval that would entitle it to conduct operations under the Middle Mesa Unit Agreement.

Your statewide oil and gas BLM Bond No. UTBOOO428will be used to cover unit operations.

It is requested that you notify all interested parties of the change in unit operator. Copies of the
approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriate Federal offices, with one copy
returned herewith.

Ifyou have any questions, contact Leslie Wilcken of this office at (801) 539-4112.

Sincerely,

/s/Roger L. Bankert

Roger L. Bankert
Chief, Branch of Minerals

Enclosure
RECElVED
JULO6 2010

DIVOFOlL,GAS&



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISlON OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

Request to Transfer Application or Permit to Drill

(This form should accompany a Sundry Notice, Form 9, requesting APD transfer)

Well name: Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25

API number: 4303731907

Location: Qtr-Qir NWSE Section 31 Township 29S Range: 25E

Company that filed original application: EnCana Oil & Gas (USA) Inc.

Date original permit was issued: 02/18/2009

Company that permit was issued to: EnCana Oil & Gas (USA) Inc.

Check Desired Action:
one

Transfer pending (unapproved) Application for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property, hereby verifies that the information as
submitted in the pending Application for Permit to Drill, remains valid and does not require revision. The new
owner of the application accepts and agrees to the information and procedures as stated in the application.

/ Transfer approved Application for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted, hereby verifies that the
information as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require
revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verified. Yes No

\f located on private land, has the ownership changed?

If so, has the surface agreement been updated?

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect the spacing or siting /
requirements for this location?
Have there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permittingor operation of this
proposed well?
Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership or right-of-way, which could affect the
proposed location?

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed?

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a change in
plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation?

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? Bond No. RLBOOl3207 X

Any desired or necessary changes to either a pending or approved Application for Permit to Drillthat is being transferred
should be filed on a Sundry Notice, Form 9, or amended Application for Permit to Drill, Form 3, as appropriate, with

necesesap assupporting Tii on as required

Title Vice-Preside t, Lapd & Business Development

Signature . Date /g

Representi (company name) diara Oil & Gas LLC

The person signing this form must have legal authority to represent the company or individual(s) to be listed as the new operator on the Applicationfor
Permit to DrilL

(3/2004) RECEIVED
|72010

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISlON OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

Request to Transfer Application or Permit to Drill

(This form should accompany a Sundry Notice, Form 9, requesting APD transfer)

Well name: Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25

API number: 4303731907

Location: Qtr-Qir NWSE Section 31 Township 29S Range: 25E

Company that filed original application: EnCana Oil & Gas (USA) Inc.

Date original permit was issued: 02/18/2009

Company that permit was issued to: EnCana Oil & Gas (USA) Inc.

Check Desired Action:
one

Transfer pending (unapproved) Application for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property, hereby verifies that the information as
submitted in the pending Application for Permit to Drill, remains valid and does not require revision. The new
owner of the application accepts and agrees to the information and procedures as stated in the application.

/ Transfer approved Application for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted, hereby verifies that the
information as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require
revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verified. Yes No

\f located on private land, has the ownership changed?

If so, has the surface agreement been updated?

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect the spacing or siting /
requirements for this location?
Have there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permittingor operation of this
proposed well?
Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership or right-of-way, which could affect the
proposed location?

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed?

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a change in
plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation?

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? Bond No. RLBOOl3207 X

Any desired or necessary changes to either a pending or approved Application for Permit to Drillthat is being transferred
should be filed on a Sundry Notice, Form 9, or amended Application for Permit to Drill, Form 3, as appropriate, with

necesesap assupporting Tii on as required

Title Vice-Preside t, Lapd & Business Development

Signature . Date /g

Representi (company name) diara Oil & Gas LLC

The person signing this form must have legal authority to represent the company or individual(s) to be listed as the new operator on the Applicationfor
Permit to DrilL

(3/2004) RECEIVED

|72010

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



API Well No: 43037319070000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-76335 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 MIDDLE MESA 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC

9. API NUMBER:
 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 600 17th Street Ste 1900S , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 SOUTH PINE RIDGE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1873 FSL 1795 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.0S Range: 25.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 SAN JUAN 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

6/1/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Patara Oil & Gas, LLC requests the extension of the above mentioned APD for
the maximum time allowable. The federal approval is valid until January 5,

2012. Please contact Christopher A. Noonan at Banko Petroleum Management,
Inc. at 303-820-4480, or at bob@banko1.com with any questions or concerns.

Thank you.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Christopher A. Noonan 303 820-4480

TITLE
 Permit Agent

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 2/10/2011

02/15/2011

iPI Well No: 43037319070000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAS7EæDE5sIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. MIDDLE MESA

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street Ste 19005 , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685 Ext SOUTH PINE RIDGE

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SAN JUAN

1873 FSL 1795 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.05 Range: 25.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

6/1/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Patara Oil & Gas, LLC requests the extension of the above mentioned APD for
the maximum time allowable. The federal approval is valid until January 5, Approved by the

2012. Please contact Christopher A. Noonan at Banko Petroleum Management, Utah Division of
Inc. at 303-820-4480, or at bob@banko1.com with any questions or concerns. Oil, Gas and Mining

Thank you.
Date: 02/15/2011

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Christopher A. Noonan 303 820-4480 Permit Agent

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A

iPI Well No: 43037319070000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAS7EæDE5sIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. MIDDLE MESA

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street Ste 19005 , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685 Ext SOUTH PINE RIDGE

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SAN JUAN

1873 FSL 1795 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.05 Range: 25.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

6/1/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Patara Oil & Gas, LLC requests the extension of the above mentioned APD for
the maximum time allowable. The federal approval is valid until January 5, Approved by the

2012. Please contact Christopher A. Noonan at Banko Petroleum Management, Utah Division of
Inc. at 303-820-4480, or at bob@banko1.com with any questions or concerns. Oil, Gas and Mining

Thank you.
Date: 02/15/2011

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Christopher A. Noonan 303 820-4480 Permit Agent

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



  

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

Request for Permit Extension Validation Well Number 43037319070000
 

API: 43037319070000
Well Name: MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25 

Location: 1873 FSL 1795 FEL QTR NWSE SEC 31 TWNP 290S RNG 250E MER S
Company Permit Issued to: PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC

Date Original Permit Issued: 2/18/2009

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted above, hereby verifies that
the information as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not
require revision. Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verified.

If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface agreement been
updated?    Yes    No

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect the spacing or
siting requirements for this location?    Yes    No

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permitting or operation
of this proposed well?    Yes    No

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or rightof- way, which could
affect the proposed location?    Yes    No

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed?    Yes    No

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a
change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation?    Yes    No

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well?    Yes    No

        
Signature:  Christopher A. Noonan Date: 2/10/2011

Title:  Permit Agent Representing: PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources
Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

TI, BAS Pr N1NTMG

Request for Permit Extension Validation Well Number 43037319070000

API: 43037319070000
Well Name: MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25

Location: 1873 FSL 1795 FEL QTR NWSE SEC 31 TWNP 290S RNG 250E MER S
Company Permit Issued to: PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC

Date Original Permit Issued: 2/18/2009

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted above, hereby verifies that
the information as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not
require revision. Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verified.

•If located on private_land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface agreement been
updated? O Yes No

• Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the roposed well which would affect the spacing or
siting requirements for this location? O Yes No

• Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permitting or operation
of this proposed well? O Yes @ No

• Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or rightof- way, which could
affect the proposed location? O Yes @ No

• Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? O Yes @ No

• Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a
change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation? O Yes @ No

• Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? @ Yes O No

Signature: Christopher A. Noonan Date: 2/10/2011
Title: Permit Agent Representing: PATARA OIL & GAS,

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices
TI, BAS Pr N1NTMG

Request for Permit Extension Validation Well Number 43037319070000

API: 43037319070000
Well Name: MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25

Location: 1873 FSL 1795 FEL QTR NWSE SEC 31 TWNP 290S RNG 250E MER S
Company Permit Issued to: PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC

Date Original Permit Issued: 2/18/2009

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted above, hereby verifies that
the information as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not
require revision. Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verified.

•If located on private_land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface agreement been
updated? O Yes No

• Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the roposed well which would affect the spacing or
siting requirements for this location? O Yes No

• Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permitting or operation
of this proposed well? O Yes @ No

• Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or rightof- way, which could
affect the proposed location? O Yes @ No

• Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? O Yes @ No

• Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a
change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation? O Yes @ No

• Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? @ Yes O No

Signature: Christopher A. Noonan Date: 2/10/2011
Title: Permit Agent Representing: PATARA OIL & GAS,



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-76335 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 MIDDLE MESA 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC

9. API NUMBER:
 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 600 17th Street Ste 1900S , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 SOUTH PINE RIDGE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1873 FSL 1795 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.0S Range: 25.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 SAN JUAN 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

7/15/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Please see attached document for clarifications to changes in the BHL, hole
sizes, casing program, and cement program. Please note the additional

changes to the wellsite layout. Please send copies of all correspondence to
either Danielle Gavito or David Banko at Banko Petroleum Management 385

Inverness Parkway, Suite 420, Englewood, CO 80112 or to
danielle@banko1.com or dave@banko1.com respectively. Thank you.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Kimberly J. Rodell 303 820-4480

TITLE
 Permit Agent

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 6/20/2011

08/01/2011

Jun. 20, 2011

Sundry Number: 16084 API Well Number: 43037319070000Federal Approval of this
Action is Necessary

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAS7E6DE55IGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. MIDDLE MESA

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Viell MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street Ste 1900S , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685 E×t SOUTH PINE RIDGE

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SAN JUAN

1873 FSL 1795 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.05 Range: 25.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

7/15/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached document for clarifications to changes in the BHL, hole
sizes, casing program, and cement program. Please note the additional

changes to the wellsite layout. Please send copies of all correspondence to Approved by the
either Danielle Gavito or David Banko at Banko Petroleum Management 385 Utah Division of

Inverness Parkway, Suite 420, Englewood, CO 80112 or to Oil, Gas and Mining
danielle@banko1.com or dave@banko1.com respectively. Thank you.

Date: 08/01/2011

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Kimberly 1 Rodell 303 820-4480 Permit Agent

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A

Federal Approval of this
Action is Necessary

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAS7E6DE55IGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. MIDDLE MESA

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Viell MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street Ste 1900S , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685 E×t SOUTH PINE RIDGE

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SAN JUAN

1873 FSL 1795 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.05 Range: 25.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

7/15/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached document for clarifications to changes in the BHL, hole
sizes, casing program, and cement program. Please note the additional

changes to the wellsite layout. Please send copies of all correspondence to Approved by the
either Danielle Gavito or David Banko at Banko Petroleum Management 385 Utah Division of

Inverness Parkway, Suite 420, Englewood, CO 80112 or to Oil, Gas and Mining
danielle@banko1.com or dave@banko1.com respectively. Thank you.

Date: 08/01/2011

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Kimberly 1 Rodell 303 820-4480 Permit Agent

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A
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MIDDLE MESA FED 31-11-29-25         
4303731910

MIDDLE MESA FED 31-22-29-25         
4303731909

MIDDLE MESA FED 5-8-30-25           
4303731908

MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25         
4303731907

MIDDLE MESA FED 31-44-29-25         
4303731906

MIDDLE MESA FED 5-10-30-25          
4303731897

MIDDLE MESA FED 31-42-29-25         
4303731895

MIDDLE MESA FED 30-41-29-25         
4303731893

MIDDLE MESA ST 36-24B-29-24         
4303731878

MCKENNA 21-32                       
4303731863

MIDDLE MESA ST 36-24-29-24          
4303731856 MIDDLE MESA FED 31-31-29-25         

4303731854

MIDDLE MESA FED 5-6-30-25           
4303731853

MIDDLE MESA ST 36-14-29-24          
4303731838

SO PINE RIDGE 7-6                   
4303730714

PIONEER 1                           
4303720343

PIONEER 2                           
4303720335
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Map Produced by Diana Mason
Map Prepared: 

Well Name: MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25
API Number: 4303731907

Township T2.9 . Section 31Range R2.5 .
Meridian: SLBM

F
1,250 0 1,250625 Feet

1:12,000

Units
STATUS

ACTIVE

EXPLORATORY

GAS STORAGE

NF PP OIL

NF SECONDARY

PI OIL

PP GAS

PP GEOTHERML

PP OIL

SECONDARY

TERMINATED

Fields
STATUS

Unknown

ABANDONED

ACTIVE

COMBINED

INACTIVE

STORAGE

TERMINATED

Sections

Township

Wells Query
Status

APD - Aproved Permit

H DRL - Spuded (Drilling Commenced)

4 GIW - Gas Injection

!* GS - Gas Storage

N LA - Location Abandoned

! LOC - New Location

7 OPS - Operation Suspended

ª PA - Plugged Abandoned

* PGW - Producing Gas Well

' POW - Producing Oil Well

O RET - Returned APD
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 United States Department of the Interior 
 
 BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 
 Utah State Office 
 P.O. Box 45155 
 Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155 
 
IN REPLY REFER TO: 
3160 
(UT-922) 
    
       July 1, 2011 
 
Memorandum 
 
To:     Assistant Field Office Manager Resources, 
  Moab Field Office 
 
From:    Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer 
 
Subject: 2011 Plan of Development Middle Mesa Unit, 

San Juan County, Utah. 
 
Pursuant to email between Diana Whitney, Division of Oil, Gas and 
Mining, and Mickey Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land 
Management, the following well has had a change in the bottom 
hole location.  The well is planned for calendar year 2011 within 
the Middle Mesa Unit, San Juan County, Utah.  
     
  API #                                 WELL NAME                                                          LOCATION 
 
(Proposed PZ Hatch) 
 
43-037-31907 Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25 Sec 31 T29S R25E 1873 FSL 1795 FEL 
                                     BHL Sec 31 T29S R25E 1670 FSL 1987 FWL 
 
 
This office has no objection to permitting the well at this time. 
 
 
 
       
 
 
 
bcc: File – Middle Mesa Unit 
 Division of Oil Gas and Mining 
 Central Files 
 Agr. Sec. Chron 
 Fluid Chron 
 
MCoulthard:mc:7-1-11 

Division of Oil Gas and Mining

Michael L. Coulthard
Digitally signed by Michael L. Coulthard 
DN: cn=Michael L. Coulthard, o=Bureau of Land Management, ou=Branch 
of Minerals, email=Michael_Coulthard@blm.gov, c=US 
Date: 2011.07.01 08:48:54 -06'00'

Jun. 20, 2011

Sundry Number: 16084 API Well Number: 43037319070000Federal Approval of this
Action is Necessary

United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office

P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155
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Jun. 20, 2011

Sundry Number: 16084 API Well Number: 43037319070000

Patara Oil & Gas LLC
Dominion Towers • 600 17th Street Suite 19008 · Denver CO 80202 Phonc 003) 825-0685 · F ix:(720) 255-4560

July 20, 2011

Ms. Diana Mason
Utah Department of Natural Resources
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, UT 84116

RE: Rule R649-3-11. Directional Drilling
Middle Mesa No. 31-33-29-25 Well
Middle Mesa Unit Federal Unit
San Juan County, Utah

Dear Ms. Mason:

Reference is made to that certain application for permit to drill (APD) covering the captioned
well, which well is presently surface located 1,873' FSLand 1,795' FEL of Section 31, T295, R25E, and
bottomhoÍe located 1,670' F5Land 1,987' FWLof said section, in San Juan County, Utah (surveyor plats
enclosed). The bottomhole location for this step out well targeting the Honaker Trail formation is
located outside the 400 feet square "window" provided for under state rule R649-3-2. In accordance
with state rule R649-3-11, Patara hereby respectfully requests an exception to said Location and Siting
Wells rule and provides the following information in support thereof:

1.) Surface location is covered under Federal Oil and Gas Lease bearing the serial number UTU-
76335 and the bottomhole under UTU-84217;

2.) All lands located within a 460' radius of the bottomhole location and all points along the
intended wellbore are committed to the Middle Mesa Federal Exploratory Unit, case
number UTU-82680X. The Unit Agreement serves to unitize all formations under the
separate unit tracts forming one unit area to effectively and efficiently develop the unitized
zones;

3.) Pursuant to the Unit Operating Agreement of the above referenced unit, Patara, as Unit
Operator, is the designated agent for those lands committed to the unit
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Jun. 20, 2011

Sundry Number: 16084 API Well Number: 43037319070000

In consideration of the foregoing, we therefore respectfully request an exception to rule R649-3-
2 for purposes of drilling the captioned well with a bottornhole at the location set forth in the revised
APD. 5hould you have any questions, regarding this matter, please do not hesitate to give me a call at
303-563-5375.

Sincerely,

Patara Oil &WasLLC
Cassandra Squyres
Land Consultant

In consideration of the foregoing, we therefore respectfully request an exception to rule R649-3-
2 for purposes of drilling the captioned well with a bottornhole at the location set forth in the revised
APD. 5hould you have any questions, regarding this matter, please do not hesitate to give me a call at
303-563-5375.

Sincerely,

Patara Oil &WasLLC
Cassandra Squyres
Land Consultant
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Sundry Number: 16084 API Well Number: 43037319070000
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Jun. 20, 2011

Sundry Number: 16084 API Well Number: 43037319070000
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Sundry Number: 16084 API Well Number: 43037319070000
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10 June, 2011

Plan: Preliminary Directional Plan for APD 06-10-11

San Juan County, UT
Section 31-T29S-R25E
Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Wellbore #1

Jun. 20, 2011

Sundry Number: 16084 API Well Number: 43037319070000

Patara Oil & Gas, LLC
San Juan County, UT
Section 31-T29S-R25E
Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Wellbore #1
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Latitude:

Easting:

Northing:

ft

+E/-W

+N/-S

Position Uncertainty

ft

ft

ftGround Level:

Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25

ft

ft

0.0

0.0

579,337.36

2,659,134.41

0.0Wellhead Elevation: ft0.0

38° 14' 7.879 N

109° 12' 18.241 W

Wellbore

Declination
(°)

Field Strength
(nT)

Sample Date Dip Angle
(°)

Wellbore #1

Model NameMagnetics

IGRF2010 05/25/11 10.70 64.46 51,386

Phase:Version:

Audit Notes:

Design Preliminary Directional Plan for APD 06-10-11

PLAN

Vertical Section: Depth From (TVD)
(ft)

+N/-S
(ft)

Direction
(°)

+E/-W
(ft)

Tie On Depth: 0.0

261.850.00.00.0

Inclination
(°)

Azimuth
(°)

+E/-W
(ft)

TFO
(°)

+N/-S
(ft)

Measured
Depth

(ft)

Vertical 
Depth

(ft)

Dogleg
Rate

(°/100ft)

Build
Rate

(°/100ft)

Turn
Rate

(°/100ft)

Plan Sections

Target

0.000.000.000.000.00.00.00.000.000.0
0.000.000.000.000.00.0200.00.000.00200.0

262.560.003.003.00-192.8-25.21,039.6262.5626.081,069.3
0.000.000.000.00-1,367.7-178.53,460.4262.5626.083,764.5

180.000.00-3.003.00-1,560.5-203.74,300.00.000.004,633.8 MM 31-33 Target 1
0.000.000.000.00-1,560.5-203.76,500.00.000.006,833.8
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Jun. 20, 2011

Sundry Number: 16084 API Well Number: 43037319070000

Crescent Directional Drilling, IP
Planning Report

Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Company: Patara Oil & Gas, LLC TVD Reference: WELL @6662.9ft (Original Well Elev)
Project: San Juan County, UT MD Reference: WELL @6662.9ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Section 31-T29S-R25E North Reference: True
Well: Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: Wellbore #1
Design: Preliminary Directional Plan for APD 06-10-11

Project San Juan County, UT

Map System: US State Plane 1927 (Exact solution) System Datum: Mean Sea Level
Geo Datum: NAD 1927 (NADCON CONUS)
Map Zone: Utah South 4303

Site Section 31-T29S-R25E

Site Position: Northing: 579,337.36ft Latitude: 38° 14' 7.879 N
From: Lat/Long Easting: 2,659,134.41ft Longitude: 109° 12'18.241 W
Position Uncertainty: 0.0 ft Slot Radius: " Grid Convergence: 1.41 °

Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25

Well Position +NI-S 0.0 ft Northing: 579,337.36 ft Latitude: 38° 14' 7.879 N
+El-W 0.0 ft Easting: 2,659,134.41 ft Longitude: 109° 12' 18.241 W

Position Uncertainty 0.0 ft Wellhead Elevation: ft Ground Level: 0.0ft

Wellbore Wellbore #1

Magnetics Model Name Sample Date Declination Dip Angle Field Strength(°) (°) (nT)
IGRF2010 05/25/11 10.70 64.46 51,386

Design Preliminary Directional Plan for APD 06-10-11

Audit Notes:
Version: Phase: PLAN Tie On Depth: 0.0

Vertical Section: Depth From (TVD) +NI-S +El-W Direction
(ft) (ft) (ft) (°)
0.0 0.0 0.0 26 1.85

Plan Sections

Measured Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Rate Rate Rate TFO

(ft) (°) (°) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°I100ft) (°I100ft) (°I100ft) (°) Target

0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
200.0 0.00 0.00 200.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

1,069.3 26.08 262.56 1,039.6 -25.2 -192.8 3.00 3.00 0.00 262.56
3,764.5 26.08 262.56 3,460.4 -178.5

-1,367.7 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,633.8 0.00 0.00 4,300.0 -203.7

-1,560.5 3.00 -3.00 0.00 180.00 MM 31-33 Target 1
6,833.8 0.00 0.00 6,500.0 -203.7

-1,560.5 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
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Crescent Directional Drilling, IP
Planning Report

Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Company: Patara Oil & Gas, LLC TVD Reference: WELL @6662.9ft (Original Well Elev)
Project: San Juan County, UT MD Reference: WELL @6662.9ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Section 31-T29S-R25E North Reference: True
Well: Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: Wellbore #1
Design: Preliminary Directional Plan for APD 06-10-11

Project San Juan County, UT

Map System: US State Plane 1927 (Exact solution) System Datum: Mean Sea Level
Geo Datum: NAD 1927 (NADCON CONUS)
Map Zone: Utah South 4303

Site Section 31-T29S-R25E

Site Position: Northing: 579,337.36ft Latitude: 38° 14' 7.879 N
From: Lat/Long Easting: 2,659,134.41ft Longitude: 109° 12'18.241 W
Position Uncertainty: 0.0 ft Slot Radius: " Grid Convergence: 1.41 °

Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25

Well Position +NI-S 0.0 ft Northing: 579,337.36 ft Latitude: 38° 14' 7.879 N
+El-W 0.0 ft Easting: 2,659,134.41 ft Longitude: 109° 12' 18.241 W

Position Uncertainty 0.0 ft Wellhead Elevation: ft Ground Level: 0.0ft

Wellbore Wellbore #1

Magnetics Model Name Sample Date Declination Dip Angle Field Strength(°) (°) (nT)
IGRF2010 05/25/11 10.70 64.46 51,386

Design Preliminary Directional Plan for APD 06-10-11

Audit Notes:
Version: Phase: PLAN Tie On Depth: 0.0

Vertical Section: Depth From (TVD) +NI-S +El-W Direction
(ft) (ft) (ft) (°)
0.0 0.0 0.0 26 1.85

Plan Sections

Measured Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Rate Rate Rate TFO

(ft) (°) (°) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°I100ft) (°I100ft) (°I100ft) (°) Target

0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
200.0 0.00 0.00 200.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

1,069.3 26.08 262.56 1,039.6 -25.2 -192.8 3.00 3.00 0.00 262.56
3,764.5 26.08 262.56 3,460.4 -178.5

-1,367.7 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,633.8 0.00 0.00 4,300.0 -203.7

-1,560.5 3.00 -3.00 0.00 180.00 MM 31-33 Target 1
6,833.8 0.00 0.00 6,500.0 -203.7

-1,560.5 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
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Project:
Company:

Local Co-ordinate Reference:
TVD Reference:

Site:

Patara Oil & Gas, LLC
San Juan County, UT
Section 31-T29S-R25E

Crescent Directional Drilling, lP
Planning Report

Well:
Wellbore:

Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Wellbore #1

Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature

WELL @ 6662.9ft (Original Well Elev)

Design: Preliminary Directional Plan for APD 06-10-11

Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

MD Reference: WELL @ 6662.9ft (Original Well Elev)
North Reference:

Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25

True

Measured
Depth

(ft)
Inclination

(°)
Azimuth

(°)
+E/-W

(ft)

Vertical
Section

(ft)

Dogleg
Rate

(°/100ft)
+N/-S

(ft)

Build
Rate

(°/100ft)

Turn
Rate

(°/100ft)

Planned Survey

Vertical 
Depth

(ft)

0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.000.0 0.0 0.00 0.00
100.0 0.00 0.00 100.0 0.0 0.000.0 0.0 0.00 0.00
200.0 0.00 0.00 200.0 0.0 0.000.0 0.0 0.00 0.00

KOP  3/100'
300.0 3.00 262.56 300.0 2.6 3.00-0.3 -2.6 3.00 0.00
400.0 6.00 262.56 399.6 10.5 3.00-1.4 -10.4 3.00 0.00

500.0 9.00 262.56 498.8 23.5 3.00-3.0 -23.3 3.00 0.00
600.0 12.00 262.56 597.1 41.7 3.00-5.4 -41.4 3.00 0.00
700.0 15.00 262.56 694.3 65.1 3.00-8.4 -64.5 3.00 0.00
800.0 18.00 262.56 790.2 93.5 3.00-12.1 -92.7 3.00 0.00
900.0 21.00 262.56 884.4 126.8 3.00-16.4 -125.8 3.00 0.00

1,000.0 24.00 262.56 976.8 165.1 3.00-21.4 -163.7 3.00 0.00
1,069.3 26.08 262.56 1,039.6 194.4 3.00-25.2 -192.8 3.00 0.00

EOB Hold 26.08 Deb
1,100.0 26.08 262.56 1,067.2 207.9 0.00-26.9 -206.2 0.00 0.00
1,200.0 26.08 262.56 1,157.0 251.9 0.00-32.6 -249.8 0.00 0.00
1,300.0 26.08 262.56 1,246.8 295.8 0.00-38.3 -293.4 0.00 0.00

1,400.0 26.08 262.56 1,336.6 339.8 0.00-44.0 -337.0 0.00 0.00
1,500.0 26.08 262.56 1,426.4 383.8 0.00-49.7 -380.6 0.00 0.00
1,600.0 26.08 262.56 1,516.3 427.7 0.00-55.4 -424.1 0.00 0.00
1,700.0 26.08 262.56 1,606.1 471.7 0.00-61.1 -467.7 0.00 0.00
1,800.0 26.08 262.56 1,695.9 515.6 0.00-66.7 -511.3 0.00 0.00

1,900.0 26.08 262.56 1,785.7 559.6 0.00-72.4 -554.9 0.00 0.00
2,000.0 26.08 262.56 1,875.5 603.5 0.00-78.1 -598.5 0.00 0.00
2,100.0 26.08 262.56 1,965.4 647.5 0.00-83.8 -642.1 0.00 0.00
2,200.0 26.08 262.56 2,055.2 691.5 0.00-89.5 -685.7 0.00 0.00
2,300.0 26.08 262.56 2,145.0 735.4 0.00-95.2 -729.3 0.00 0.00

2,400.0 26.08 262.56 2,234.8 779.4 0.00-100.9 -772.9 0.00 0.00
2,500.0 26.08 262.56 2,324.6 823.3 0.00-106.6 -816.5 0.00 0.00
2,600.0 26.08 262.56 2,414.5 867.3 0.00-112.3 -860.1 0.00 0.00
2,700.0 26.08 262.56 2,504.3 911.2 0.00-118.0 -903.6 0.00 0.00
2,800.0 26.08 262.56 2,594.1 955.2 0.00-123.7 -947.2 0.00 0.00

2,900.0 26.08 262.56 2,683.9 999.2 0.00-129.3 -990.8 0.00 0.00
2,917.9 26.08 262.56 2,700.0 1,007.0 0.00-130.4 -998.6 0.00 0.00

8 5/8"
3,000.0 26.08 262.56 2,773.7 1,043.1 0.00-135.0 -1,034.4 0.00 0.00
3,100.0 26.08 262.56 2,863.5 1,087.1 0.00-140.7 -1,078.0 0.00 0.00
3,200.0 26.08 262.56 2,953.4 1,131.0 0.00-146.4 -1,121.6 0.00 0.00

3,300.0 26.08 262.56 3,043.2 1,175.0 0.00-152.1 -1,165.2 0.00 0.00
3,400.0 26.08 262.56 3,133.0 1,218.9 0.00-157.8 -1,208.8 0.00 0.00
3,500.0 26.08 262.56 3,222.8 1,262.9 0.00-163.5 -1,252.4 0.00 0.00
3,600.0 26.08 262.56 3,312.6 1,306.9 0.00-169.2 -1,296.0 0.00 0.00
3,700.0 26.08 262.56 3,402.5 1,350.8 0.00-174.9 -1,339.6 0.00 0.00

3,764.5 26.08 262.56 3,460.4 1,379.2 0.00-178.5 -1,367.7 0.00 0.00
Start Drop -3/100

3,800.0 25.01 262.56 3,492.4 1,394.5 3.00-180.5 -1,382.8 -3.00 0.00
3,900.0 22.01 262.56 3,584.1 1,434.4 3.00-185.7 -1,422.4 -3.00 0.00
4,000.0 19.01 262.56 3,677.8 1,469.4 3.00-190.2 -1,457.2 -3.00 0.00
4,100.0 16.01 262.56 3,773.1 1,499.5 3.00-194.1 -1,487.0 -3.00 0.00

4,200.0 13.01 262.56 3,869.9 1,524.5 3.00-197.4 -1,511.8 -3.00 0.00
4,300.0 10.01 262.56 3,967.9 1,544.5 3.00-199.9 -1,531.6 -3.00 0.00
4,400.0 7.01 262.56 4,066.8 1,559.3 3.00-201.9 -1,546.3 -3.00 0.00
4,500.0 4.01 262.56 4,166.3 1,568.9 3.00-203.1 -1,555.8 -3.00 0.00
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Jun. 20, 2011

Sundry Number: 16084 API Well Number: 43037319070000

Crescent Directional Drilling, IP
Planning Report

Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Company: Patara Oil & Gas, LLC TVD Reference: WELL @6662.9ft (Original Well Elev)
Project: San Juan County, UT MD Reference: WELL @6662.9ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Section 31-T29S-R25E North Reference: True
Well: Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: Wellbore #1
Design: Preliminary Directional Plan for APD 06-10-11

Planned Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(II) (°) (°) (II) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°I100ft) (°I100ft) (°I100ft)

0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
100.0 0.00 0.00 100.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
200.0 0.00 0.00 200.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00

KOP 3/100'
300.0 3.00 262.56 300.0 -0.3 -2.6 2.6 3.00 3.00 0.00
400.0 6.00 262.56 399.6 -1.4 -10.4 10.5 3.00 3.00 0.00

500.0 9.00 262.56 498.8 -3.0 -23.3 23.5 3.00 3.00 0.00
600.0 12.00 262.56 597.1 -5.4 -41.4 41.7 3.00 3.00 0.00
700.0 15.00 262.56 694.3 -8.4 -64.5 65.1 3.00 3.00 0.00
800.0 18.00 262.56 790.2 -12.1 -92.7 93.5 3.00 3.00 0.00
900.0 21.00 262.56 884.4 -16.4 -125.8 126.8 3.00 3.00 0.00

1,000.0 24.00 262.56 976.8 -21.4 -163.7 165.1 3.00 3.00 0.00
1,069.3 26.08 262.56 1,039.6 -25.2 -192.8 194.4 3.00 3.00 0.00

EOB Hold 26.08 Deb
1,100.0 26.08 262.56 1,067.2 -26.9 -206.2 207.9 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,200.0 26.08 262.56 1,157.0 -32.6 -249.8 251.9 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,300.0 26.08 262.56 1,246.8 -38.3 -293.4 295.8 0.00 0.00 0.00

1,400.0 26.08 262.56 1,336.6 -44.0 -337.0 339.8 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,500.0 26.08 262.56 1,426.4 -49.7 -380.6 383.8 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,600.0 26.08 262.56 1,516.3 -55.4 -424.1 427.7 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,700.0 26.08 262.56 1,606.1 -61.1 -467.7 471.7 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,800.0 26.08 262.56 1,695.9 -66.7 -511.3 515.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

1,900.0 26.08 262.56 1,785.7 -72.4 -554.9 559.6 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,000.0 26.08 262.56 1,875.5 -78.1 -598.5 603.5 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,100.0 26.08 262.56 1,965.4 -83.8 -642.1 647.5 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,200.0 26.08 262.56 2,055.2 -89.5 -685.7 691.5 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,300.0 26.08 262.56 2,145.0 -95.2 -729.3 735.4 0.00 0.00 0.00

2,400.0 26.08 262.56 2,234.8 -100.9 -772.9 779.4 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,500.0 26.08 262.56 2,324.6 -106.6 -816.5 823.3 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,600.0 26.08 262.56 2,414.5 -112.3 -860.1 867.3 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,700.0 26.08 262.56 2,504.3 -118.0 -903.6 911.2 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,800.0 26.08 262.56 2,594.1 -123.7 -947.2 955.2 0.00 0.00 0.00

2,900.0 26.08 262.56 2,683.9 -129.3 -990.8 999.2 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,917.9 26.08 262.56 2,700.0 -130.4 -998.6 1,007.0 0.00 0.00 0.00

8 5/8"
3,000.0 26.08 262.56 2,773.7 -135.0

-1,034.4 1,043.1 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,100.0 26.08 262.56 2,863.5 -140.7

-1,078.0 1,087.1 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,200.0 26.08 262.56 2,953.4 -146.4

-1,121.6 1,131.0 0.00 0.00 0.00

3,300.0 26.08 262.56 3,043.2 -152.1
-1,165.2 1,175.0 0.00 0.00 0.00

3,400.0 26.08 262.56 3,133.0 -157.8
-1,208.8 1,218.9 0.00 0.00 0.00

3,500.0 26.08 262.56 3,222.8 -163.5
-1,252.4 1,262.9 0.00 0.00 0.00

3,600.0 26.08 262.56 3,312.6 -169.2
-1,296.0 1,306.9 0.00 0.00 0.00

3,700.0 26.08 262.56 3,402.5 -174.9
-1,339.6 1,350.8 0.00 0.00 0.00

3,764.5 26.08 262.56 3,460.4 -178.5
-1,367.7 1,379.2 0.00 0.00 0.00

Start Drop -3/100

3,800.0 25.01 262.56 3,492.4 -180.5
-1,382.8 1,394.5 3.00 -3.00 0.00

3,900.0 22.01 262.56 3,584.1 -185.7
-1,422.4 1,434.4 3.00 -3.00 0.00

4,000.0 19.01 262.56 3,677.8 -190.2
-1,457.2 1,469.4 3.00 -3.00 0.00

4,100.0 16.01 262.56 3,773.1 -194.1
-1,487.0 1,499.5 3.00 -3.00 0.00

4,200.0 13.01 262.56 3,869.9 -197.4
-1,511.8 1,524.5 3.00 -3.00 0.00

4,300.0 10.01 262.56 3,967.9 -199.9
-1,531.6 1,544.5 3.00 -3.00 0.00

4,400.0 7.01 262.56 4,066.8 -201.9
-1,546.3 1,559.3 3.00 -3.00 0.00

4,500.0 4.01 262.56 4,166.3 -203.1
-1,555.8 1,568.9 3.00 -3.00 0.00
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Crescent Directional Drilling, IP
Planning Report

Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Company: Patara Oil & Gas, LLC TVD Reference: WELL @6662.9ft (Original Well Elev)
Project: San Juan County, UT MD Reference: WELL @6662.9ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Section 31-T29S-R25E North Reference: True
Well: Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: Wellbore #1
Design: Preliminary Directional Plan for APD 06-10-11

Planned Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(II) (°) (°) (II) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°I100ft) (°I100ft) (°I100ft)

0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
100.0 0.00 0.00 100.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
200.0 0.00 0.00 200.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00

KOP 3/100'
300.0 3.00 262.56 300.0 -0.3 -2.6 2.6 3.00 3.00 0.00
400.0 6.00 262.56 399.6 -1.4 -10.4 10.5 3.00 3.00 0.00

500.0 9.00 262.56 498.8 -3.0 -23.3 23.5 3.00 3.00 0.00
600.0 12.00 262.56 597.1 -5.4 -41.4 41.7 3.00 3.00 0.00
700.0 15.00 262.56 694.3 -8.4 -64.5 65.1 3.00 3.00 0.00
800.0 18.00 262.56 790.2 -12.1 -92.7 93.5 3.00 3.00 0.00
900.0 21.00 262.56 884.4 -16.4 -125.8 126.8 3.00 3.00 0.00

1,000.0 24.00 262.56 976.8 -21.4 -163.7 165.1 3.00 3.00 0.00
1,069.3 26.08 262.56 1,039.6 -25.2 -192.8 194.4 3.00 3.00 0.00

EOB Hold 26.08 Deb
1,100.0 26.08 262.56 1,067.2 -26.9 -206.2 207.9 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,200.0 26.08 262.56 1,157.0 -32.6 -249.8 251.9 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,300.0 26.08 262.56 1,246.8 -38.3 -293.4 295.8 0.00 0.00 0.00

1,400.0 26.08 262.56 1,336.6 -44.0 -337.0 339.8 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,500.0 26.08 262.56 1,426.4 -49.7 -380.6 383.8 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,600.0 26.08 262.56 1,516.3 -55.4 -424.1 427.7 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,700.0 26.08 262.56 1,606.1 -61.1 -467.7 471.7 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,800.0 26.08 262.56 1,695.9 -66.7 -511.3 515.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

1,900.0 26.08 262.56 1,785.7 -72.4 -554.9 559.6 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,000.0 26.08 262.56 1,875.5 -78.1 -598.5 603.5 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,100.0 26.08 262.56 1,965.4 -83.8 -642.1 647.5 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,200.0 26.08 262.56 2,055.2 -89.5 -685.7 691.5 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,300.0 26.08 262.56 2,145.0 -95.2 -729.3 735.4 0.00 0.00 0.00

2,400.0 26.08 262.56 2,234.8 -100.9 -772.9 779.4 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,500.0 26.08 262.56 2,324.6 -106.6 -816.5 823.3 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,600.0 26.08 262.56 2,414.5 -112.3 -860.1 867.3 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,700.0 26.08 262.56 2,504.3 -118.0 -903.6 911.2 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,800.0 26.08 262.56 2,594.1 -123.7 -947.2 955.2 0.00 0.00 0.00

2,900.0 26.08 262.56 2,683.9 -129.3 -990.8 999.2 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,917.9 26.08 262.56 2,700.0 -130.4 -998.6 1,007.0 0.00 0.00 0.00

8 5/8"
3,000.0 26.08 262.56 2,773.7 -135.0

-1,034.4 1,043.1 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,100.0 26.08 262.56 2,863.5 -140.7

-1,078.0 1,087.1 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,200.0 26.08 262.56 2,953.4 -146.4

-1,121.6 1,131.0 0.00 0.00 0.00

3,300.0 26.08 262.56 3,043.2 -152.1
-1,165.2 1,175.0 0.00 0.00 0.00

3,400.0 26.08 262.56 3,133.0 -157.8
-1,208.8 1,218.9 0.00 0.00 0.00

3,500.0 26.08 262.56 3,222.8 -163.5
-1,252.4 1,262.9 0.00 0.00 0.00

3,600.0 26.08 262.56 3,312.6 -169.2
-1,296.0 1,306.9 0.00 0.00 0.00

3,700.0 26.08 262.56 3,402.5 -174.9
-1,339.6 1,350.8 0.00 0.00 0.00

3,764.5 26.08 262.56 3,460.4 -178.5
-1,367.7 1,379.2 0.00 0.00 0.00

Start Drop -3/100

3,800.0 25.01 262.56 3,492.4 -180.5
-1,382.8 1,394.5 3.00 -3.00 0.00

3,900.0 22.01 262.56 3,584.1 -185.7
-1,422.4 1,434.4 3.00 -3.00 0.00

4,000.0 19.01 262.56 3,677.8 -190.2
-1,457.2 1,469.4 3.00 -3.00 0.00

4,100.0 16.01 262.56 3,773.1 -194.1
-1,487.0 1,499.5 3.00 -3.00 0.00

4,200.0 13.01 262.56 3,869.9 -197.4
-1,511.8 1,524.5 3.00 -3.00 0.00

4,300.0 10.01 262.56 3,967.9 -199.9
-1,531.6 1,544.5 3.00 -3.00 0.00

4,400.0 7.01 262.56 4,066.8 -201.9
-1,546.3 1,559.3 3.00 -3.00 0.00

4,500.0 4.01 262.56 4,166.3 -203.1
-1,555.8 1,568.9 3.00 -3.00 0.00
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Project:
Company:

Local Co-ordinate Reference:
TVD Reference:

Site:

Patara Oil & Gas, LLC
San Juan County, UT
Section 31-T29S-R25E

Crescent Directional Drilling, lP
Planning Report

Well:
Wellbore:

Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Wellbore #1

Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature

WELL @ 6662.9ft (Original Well Elev)

Design: Preliminary Directional Plan for APD 06-10-11

Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

MD Reference: WELL @ 6662.9ft (Original Well Elev)
North Reference:

Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25

True

Measured
Depth

(ft)
Inclination

(°)
Azimuth

(°)
+E/-W

(ft)

Vertical
Section

(ft)

Dogleg
Rate

(°/100ft)
+N/-S

(ft)

Build
Rate

(°/100ft)

Turn
Rate

(°/100ft)

Planned Survey

Vertical 
Depth

(ft)

4,600.0 1.01 262.56 4,266.2 1,573.3 3.00-203.7 -1,560.2 -3.00 0.00

4,633.8 0.00 262.56 4,300.0 1,573.6 3.00-203.7 -1,560.5 -3.00 0.00
EOD Hold 0 Degrees - MM 31-33 Target 1

4,700.0 0.00 0.00 4,366.2 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00
4,800.0 0.00 0.00 4,466.2 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00
4,900.0 0.00 0.00 4,566.2 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00
5,000.0 0.00 0.00 4,666.2 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00

5,100.0 0.00 0.00 4,766.2 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00
5,200.0 0.00 0.00 4,866.2 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00
5,300.0 0.00 0.00 4,966.2 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00
5,400.0 0.00 0.00 5,066.2 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00
5,500.0 0.00 0.00 5,166.2 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00

5,600.0 0.00 0.00 5,266.2 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00
5,700.0 0.00 0.00 5,366.2 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00
5,800.0 0.00 0.00 5,466.2 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00
5,900.0 0.00 0.00 5,566.2 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00
6,000.0 0.00 0.00 5,666.2 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00

6,100.0 0.00 0.00 5,766.2 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00
6,200.0 0.00 0.00 5,866.2 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00
6,300.0 0.00 0.00 5,966.2 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00
6,400.0 0.00 0.00 6,066.2 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00
6,500.0 0.00 0.00 6,166.2 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00

6,600.0 0.00 0.00 6,266.2 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00
6,700.0 0.00 0.00 6,366.2 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00
6,800.0 0.00 0.00 6,466.2 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00
6,833.8 0.00 0.00 6,500.0 1,573.6 0.00-203.7 -1,560.5 0.00 0.00

TD = 6,834' MD

Target Name
     - hit/miss target
     - Shape

TVD
(ft)

Northing
(ft)

Easting
(ft)

+N/-S
(ft)

+E/-W
(ft)

Targets

LongitudeLatitude

Dip Angle
(°)

Dip Dir.
(°)

MM 31-33 Target 1 4,300.0 579,095.42 2,657,579.40-203.7 -1,560.50.00 0.00 38° 14' 5.865 N 109° 12' 37.799 W
- plan hits target center
- Circle (radius 50.0)

Vertical 
Depth

(ft)

Measured 
Depth

(ft)

Casing
Diameter

(")

Hole
Diameter

(")Name

Casing Points

8 5/8"2,700.02,917.9 8-5/8 12-1/4
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Jun. 20, 2011

Sundry Number: 16084 API Well Number: 43037319070000

Crescent Directional Drilling, IP
Planning Report

Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Company: Patara Oil & Gas, LLC TVD Reference: WELL @6662.9ft (Original Well Elev)
Project: San Juan County, UT MD Reference: WELL @6662.9ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Section 31-T29S-R25E North Reference: True
Well: Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: Wellbore #1
Design: Preliminary Directional Plan for APD 06-10-11

Planned Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(II) (°) (°) (II) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°I100ft) (°I100ft) (°I100ft)

4,600.0 1.01 262.56 4,266.2 -203.7
-1,560.2 1,573.3 3.00 -3.00 0.00

4,633.8 0.00 262.56 4,300.0 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 3.00 -3.00 0.00

EOD Hold 0 Degrees - MM31-33 Target 1
4,700.0 0.00 0.00 4,366.2 -203.7

-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,800.0 0.00 0.00 4,466.2 -203.7

-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,900.0 0.00 0.00 4,566.2 -203.7

-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00
5,000.0 0.00 0.00 4,666.2 -203.7

-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

5,100.0 0.00 0.00 4,766.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

5,200.0 0.00 0.00 4,866.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

5,300.0 0.00 0.00 4,966.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

5,400.0 0.00 0.00 5,066.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

5,500.0 0.00 0.00 5,166.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

5,600.0 0.00 0.00 5,266.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

5,700.0 0.00 0.00 5,366.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

5,800.0 0.00 0.00 5,466.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

5,900.0 0.00 0.00 5,566.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

6,000.0 0.00 0.00 5,666.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

6,100.0 0.00 0.00 5,766.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

6,200.0 0.00 0.00 5,866.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

6,300.0 0.00 0.00 5,966.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

6,400.0 0.00 0.00 6,066.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

6,500.0 0.00 0.00 6,166.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

6,600.0 0.00 0.00 6,266.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

6,700.0 0.00 0.00 6,366.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

6,800.0 0.00 0.00 6,466.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

6,833.8 0.00 0.00 6,500.0 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

TD = 6,834' MD

Targets

Target Name
- hit/miss target Dip Angle Dip Dir. TVD +NI-S +El-W Northing Easting
- Shape (°) (°) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) Latitude Longitude

MM 31-33 Target 1 0.00 0.00 4,300.0 -203.7
-1,560.5 579,095.42 2,657,579.40 38° 14' 5.865 N 109° 12' 37.799 W

- plan hits target center
- Circle (radius 50.0)

Casinq Points

Measured Vertical Casing Hole
Depth Depth Diameter Diameter

(ft) (ft) Name (") (")
2,917.9 2,700.0 8 5/8" 8-5/8 12-1/4
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Crescent Directional Drilling, IP
Planning Report

Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Company: Patara Oil & Gas, LLC TVD Reference: WELL @6662.9ft (Original Well Elev)
Project: San Juan County, UT MD Reference: WELL @6662.9ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Section 31-T29S-R25E North Reference: True
Well: Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: Wellbore #1
Design: Preliminary Directional Plan for APD 06-10-11

Planned Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(II) (°) (°) (II) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°I100ft) (°I100ft) (°I100ft)

4,600.0 1.01 262.56 4,266.2 -203.7
-1,560.2 1,573.3 3.00 -3.00 0.00

4,633.8 0.00 262.56 4,300.0 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 3.00 -3.00 0.00

EOD Hold 0 Degrees - MM31-33 Target 1
4,700.0 0.00 0.00 4,366.2 -203.7

-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,800.0 0.00 0.00 4,466.2 -203.7

-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,900.0 0.00 0.00 4,566.2 -203.7

-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00
5,000.0 0.00 0.00 4,666.2 -203.7

-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

5,100.0 0.00 0.00 4,766.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

5,200.0 0.00 0.00 4,866.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

5,300.0 0.00 0.00 4,966.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

5,400.0 0.00 0.00 5,066.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

5,500.0 0.00 0.00 5,166.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

5,600.0 0.00 0.00 5,266.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

5,700.0 0.00 0.00 5,366.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

5,800.0 0.00 0.00 5,466.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

5,900.0 0.00 0.00 5,566.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

6,000.0 0.00 0.00 5,666.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

6,100.0 0.00 0.00 5,766.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

6,200.0 0.00 0.00 5,866.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

6,300.0 0.00 0.00 5,966.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

6,400.0 0.00 0.00 6,066.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

6,500.0 0.00 0.00 6,166.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

6,600.0 0.00 0.00 6,266.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

6,700.0 0.00 0.00 6,366.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

6,800.0 0.00 0.00 6,466.2 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

6,833.8 0.00 0.00 6,500.0 -203.7
-1,560.5 1,573.6 0.00 0.00 0.00

TD = 6,834' MD

Targets

Target Name
- hit/miss target Dip Angle Dip Dir. TVD +NI-S +El-W Northing Easting
- Shape (°) (°) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) Latitude Longitude

MM 31-33 Target 1 0.00 0.00 4,300.0 -203.7
-1,560.5 579,095.42 2,657,579.40 38° 14' 5.865 N 109° 12' 37.799 W

- plan hits target center
- Circle (radius 50.0)

Casinq Points

Measured Vertical Casing Hole
Depth Depth Diameter Diameter

(ft) (ft) Name (") (")
2,917.9 2,700.0 8 5/8" 8-5/8 12-1/4
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Project:
Company:

Local Co-ordinate Reference:
TVD Reference:

Site:

Patara Oil & Gas, LLC
San Juan County, UT
Section 31-T29S-R25E

Crescent Directional Drilling, lP
Planning Report

Well:
Wellbore:

Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Wellbore #1

Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature

WELL @ 6662.9ft (Original Well Elev)

Design: Preliminary Directional Plan for APD 06-10-11

Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

MD Reference: WELL @ 6662.9ft (Original Well Elev)
North Reference:

Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25

True

Measured
Depth

(ft)

Vertical
Depth

(ft)
+E/-W

(ft)
+N/-S

(ft)

Local Coordinates

Comment

Plan Annotations

200.0 200.0 0.0 0.0 KOP  3/100'
1,069.3 1,039.6 -25.2 -192.8 EOB Hold 26.08 Deb
3,764.5 3,460.4 -178.5 -1,367.7 Start Drop -3/100
4,633.8 4,300.0 -203.7 -1,560.5 EOD Hold 0 Degrees
6,833.8 6,500.0 -203.7 -1,560.5 TD = 6,834' MD
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Jun. 20, 2011

Sundry Number: 16084 API Well Number: 43037319070000

Crescent Directional Drilling, IP
Planning Report

Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Company: Patara Oil & Gas, LLC TVD Reference: WELL @6662.9ft (Original Well Elev)
Project: San Juan County, UT MD Reference: WELL @6662.9ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Section 31-T29S-R25E North Reference: True
Well: Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: Wellbore #1
Design: Preliminary Directional Plan for APD 06-10-11

Plan Annotations

Measured Vertical Local Coordinates
Depth Depth +NI-S +El-W

(II) (ft) (ft) (ft) Comment
200.0 200.0 0.0 0.0 KOP 3/100'

1,069.3 1,039.6 -25.2 -192.8 EOB Hold 26.08 Deb
3,764.5 3,460.4 -178.5

-1,367.7 Start Drop -3/100

4,633.8 4,300.0 -203.7
-1,560.5 EOD Hold 0 Degrees

6,833.8 6,500.0 -203.7
-1,560.5 TD = 6,834' MD
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Crescent Directional Drilling, IP
Planning Report

Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Company: Patara Oil & Gas, LLC TVD Reference: WELL @6662.9ft (Original Well Elev)
Project: San Juan County, UT MD Reference: WELL @6662.9ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Section 31-T29S-R25E North Reference: True
Well: Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: Wellbore #1
Design: Preliminary Directional Plan for APD 06-10-11

Plan Annotations

Measured Vertical Local Coordinates
Depth Depth +NI-S +El-W

(II) (ft) (ft) (ft) Comment
200.0 200.0 0.0 0.0 KOP 3/100'

1,069.3 1,039.6 -25.2 -192.8 EOB Hold 26.08 Deb
3,764.5 3,460.4 -178.5

-1,367.7 Start Drop -3/100

4,633.8 4,300.0 -203.7
-1,560.5 EOD Hold 0 Degrees

6,833.8 6,500.0 -203.7
-1,560.5 TD = 6,834' MD
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Middle Mesa Fed 31-33 Drilling Sundry Changes 
Ryan Calhoun – 6/14/11 

 
Hole Size Changes 

Surface Hole to 2700’ 

 

Production Hole to 6834’ MD, 6500’ TVD 

8-3/4” to 7-7/8” 

 

 

Casing Changes 

Surface Casing 

9-5/8” 36# J-55 ST&C to 8-5/8” 32# ST&C 

 

Production Casing 

5-1/2” 17# L-80 LT&C to 4-1/2” 11.60# N-80 LT&C 

 

 

Cement Volumes and Tops 

Surface Cement 

Surface Lead and Tail volumes will remain as permitted (TOC @ Surface) (TOC @ 2700’) 

 

Production Cement 

540 sxs of Type III 35/65 Poz + 6% Gel, 12.5 ppg, 2.16 cuft/sx yield (TOC @ 2400’, 300’ above 8-5/8” 
surface csg shoe) 

Jun. 20, 2011

Sundry Number: 16084 API Well Number: 43037319070000

Middle Mesa Fed 31-33 Drilling Sundry Changes

Ryan Calhoun - 6/14/11

Hole Size Changes

Surface Hole to 2700'

Production Hole to 6834' MD, 6500' TVD

8-3/4" to 7-7/8"

Casing Changes

Surface Casing

9-5/8" 36# J-55 ST&Cto 8-5/8" 32# ST&C

Production casing

5-1/2" 17# L-80 LT&Cto 4-1/2" 11.60# N-80 LT&C

Cement Volumes and Tops

Surface Cement

Surface Lead and Tail volumes will remain as permitted (TOC@Surface) (TOC@2700')

Production Cement

540 sxs of Type Ill 35/65 Poz + 6% Gel, 12.5 ppg, 2.16 cuft/sx yield (TOC@ 2400', 300' above 8-5/8"

surface csg

Middle Mesa Fed 31-33 Drilling Sundry Changes
Ryan Calhoun - 6/14/11

Hole Size Changes

Surface Hole to 2700'

Production Hole to 6834' MD, 6500' TVD

8-3/4" to 7-7/8"

Casing Changes

Surface Casing

9-5/8" 36# J-55 ST&C to 8-5/8" 32# ST&C

Production Casing

5-1/2" 17# L-80 LT&C to 4-1/2" 11.60# N-80 LT&C

Cement Volumes and Tops

Surface Cement

Surface Lead and Tail volumes will remain as permitted (TOC @ Surface) (TOC @ 2700')

Production Cement

540 sxs of Type III 35/65 Poz + 6% Gel, 12.5 ppg, 2.16 cuft/sx yield (TOC @ 2400', 300' above 8-5/8"

surface csg



CONFilENTIAL
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTU76335
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use thisform for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° Middie Mesa - UTU82680Xdrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1.TYPEOFVVELL 8.\¾ELLNAMEandNUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Patara Oil & Gas LLC 4303731907
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

600 17th St. Suite 1900S gy Denver STATE CO ZlP 80202 (303) 825-0685 Pine Ridge South
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1873FSL 1795FEL COUNTY: San Juan County, UT

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWSE 31 29S 25E S STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

8/3/2011 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Origina1Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Patara Oil & Gas LLC (Patara) proposes the following changes to the approved Application for Permit to Drill: Patara will not
utilize a reserve pit, and willdrillthe well with a closed loop drillingsystem.

Patara wishes to stockpile drilled solids on a corner of the permitted pad, will allow cuttings to dry, and upon completion of the
well, willspread the solids over the pad and utilize as a base for interim reclamation.

Ifthere are any questions with this request, please contact Patara DrillingEngineer Ryan Calhoun at 303-563-5373. Thank
you.

Acceptedby the
UtahDivision of

Oil, GasandMining

FORRECORDONLY

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) Christopher A. Noonan TITLE PfOduction Technician

SIGNATURE DATE 7/27/2011

(This space for State use only)

AnderalApproval of t
Actíonis Necessaty -

RECEIVED
AUG0 1 2011

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
DNOF01, GAS&

CONFilENTIAL
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTU76335
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use thisform for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° Middie Mesa - UTU82680Xdrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1.TYPEOFVVELL 8.\¾ELLNAMEandNUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Patara Oil & Gas LLC 4303731907
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

600 17th St. Suite 1900S gy Denver STATE CO ZlP 80202 (303) 825-0685 Pine Ridge South
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1873FSL 1795FEL COUNTY: San Juan County, UT

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWSE 31 29S 25E S STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

8/3/2011 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Origina1Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Patara Oil & Gas LLC (Patara) proposes the following changes to the approved Application for Permit to Drill: Patara will not
utilize a reserve pit, and willdrillthe well with a closed loop drillingsystem.

Patara wishes to stockpile drilled solids on a corner of the permitted pad, will allow cuttings to dry, and upon completion of the
well, willspread the solids over the pad and utilize as a base for interim reclamation.

Ifthere are any questions with this request, please contact Patara DrillingEngineer Ryan Calhoun at 303-563-5373. Thank
you.

Acceptedby the
UtahDivision of

Oil, GasandMining

FORRECORDONLY

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) Christopher A. Noonan TITLE PfOduction Technician

SIGNATURE DATE 7/27/2011

(This space for State use only)

AnderalApproval of t
Actíonis Necessaty -

RECEIVED
AUG0 1 2011

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
DNOF01, GAS&



CONRDERL
FORM 9STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTU76335
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° Middle Mesa - UTU82680Xdrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Patara Oil & Gas LLC 4303731907
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

600 17th St. Suite 1900S e,,, Denver STATE CO zie 80202 (303) 825-0685 Pine Ridge South
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1873FSL 1795FEL COUNTY: San Juan County, UT

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWSE 31 29S 25E S STATE:
UTAH

ii. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ^CIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER: Well Spud
8/9/2011 O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Patara Oil & Gas LLC (Patara) spud the Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25 gas well with Frontier Rig 4 at 09:30 PM on August 9,
2011.

Please contact Christopher Noonan with Patara with any questions. Thank you.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Christopher A. Noonan TITLE Production Technician

SIGNATURE DATE 8/10/2011

FCFIVED
(This space for State use only)

AUS15 2011
DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MINING

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse

CONRDERL
FORM 9STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTU76335
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° Middle Mesa - UTU82680Xdrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Patara Oil & Gas LLC 4303731907
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

600 17th St. Suite 1900S e,,, Denver STATE CO zie 80202 (303) 825-0685 Pine Ridge South
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1873FSL 1795FEL COUNTY: San Juan County, UT

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWSE 31 29S 25E S STATE:
UTAH

ii. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ^CIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER: Well Spud
8/9/2011 O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Patara Oil & Gas LLC (Patara) spud the Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25 gas well with Frontier Rig 4 at 09:30 PM on August 9,
2011.

Please contact Christopher Noonan with Patara with any questions. Thank you.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Christopher A. Noonan TITLE Production Technician

SIGNATURE DATE 8/10/2011

FCFIVED
(This space for State use only)

AUS15 2011
DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MINING

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTU76335

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantlydeepen existingwellsbelow currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells,or t° Middle Mesa - UTU82680Xdrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Patara Oil & Gas LLC 4303731907
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

600 17th St. Suite 1900S Denver STATE CO ZIP 80202 (303) 825-0685 Pine Ridge South
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1873FSL 1795FEL COUNTY: San Juan County, UT

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWSE 31 29S 25E S STATE:
UTAH

ii. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

8/15/2011 7 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBlNG REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUGBACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER:

CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Patara Oil & Gas LLC (Patara) anticipates the need to lay the pipeline for thiswellsite along the access road on the surface, in
opposition to burying the pipeline as stated in the original Application for Permit to Drill.

A 6" trunkline is buried along the access road leading from the Middle Mesa Fed 5-6-30-25 wellsite, and progresses North to
the intersection with County Road 191, aka Coyote Wash Road. Patara requests authorization to install 4" STD wall, ERW,
non-coated pipe, on the surface, along the access road leading from the wellsite to the tie in point with the trunkline.

This is necessary due to solid rock encountered beneath the topsoil.All other wells in the area have been installed with
pipelines laid in this manner.

Please see attached pipeline map.

Please contact Christopher Noonan with Patara with any questions. Thank you.

SNAME(PULREEASEPR TITLEE

(This space for State use only) Accepted by the
Utah Division of FederalApprovalOfThis MINING

Oil, Gas and Mining ActionisNecessary D WNING

(5/2000)
For Record Only

(See Instructions on Reverse

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTU76335

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantlydeepen existingwellsbelow currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells,or t° Middle Mesa - UTU82680Xdrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Patara Oil & Gas LLC 4303731907
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

600 17th St. Suite 1900S Denver STATE CO ZIP 80202 (303) 825-0685 Pine Ridge South
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1873FSL 1795FEL COUNTY: San Juan County, UT

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWSE 31 29S 25E S STATE:
UTAH

ii. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

8/15/2011 7 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBlNG REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUGBACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER:

CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Patara Oil & Gas LLC (Patara) anticipates the need to lay the pipeline for thiswellsite along the access road on the surface, in
opposition to burying the pipeline as stated in the original Application for Permit to Drill.

A 6" trunkline is buried along the access road leading from the Middle Mesa Fed 5-6-30-25 wellsite, and progresses North to
the intersection with County Road 191, aka Coyote Wash Road. Patara requests authorization to install 4" STD wall, ERW,
non-coated pipe, on the surface, along the access road leading from the wellsite to the tie in point with the trunkline.

This is necessary due to solid rock encountered beneath the topsoil.All other wells in the area have been installed with
pipelines laid in this manner.

Please see attached pipeline map.

Please contact Christopher Noonan with Patara with any questions. Thank you.

SNAME(PULREEASEPR TITLEE

(This space for State use only) Accepted by the
Utah Division of FederalApprovalOfThis MINING

Oil, Gas and Mining ActionisNecessary D WNING

(5/2000)
For Record Only

(See Instructions on Reverse
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PROPOSED PIPELINE

RIFFIN & ASSOCIATES, INC. PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC
(307)362-5028 1414 ELK ST., ROOK SPRINGS, WY82901 MTDDLE MESA FEDERAL 31-33-29-25
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(307)362-5028 1414 ELK ST., ROOK SPRINGS, WY82901 MTDDLE MESA FEDERAL 31-33-29-25

DRAWN: 7/09/08 SCALE: 1"=2000' SECTION 31, T29S, R24E, SALT IAEE B.M.
REVISED: 6/2/11 - TCM DRG JOB No. 16537 TOTAL PROPOSED LENGTH: 1514'±
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STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-76335 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 MIDDLE MESA 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC

9. API NUMBER:
 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 600 17th Street Ste 1900S , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 SOUTH PINE RIDGE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1873 FSL 1795 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.0S Range: 25.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 SAN JUAN 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

8/21/2011

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25 reached total depth on August 21, 2011
with Frontier Rig 4 at 6,247 feet. The rig was moved off location on August

24, 2011.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Christopher Noonan 303 563-5377

TITLE
 Production Technician

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 8/30/2011

08/30/2011

Aug. 30, 2011

Sundry Number: 17953 API Well Number: 43037319070000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAS7E6DE55IGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. MIDDLE MESA

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Viell MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street Ste 1900S , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685 E×t SOUTH PINE RIDGE

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SAN JUAN

1873 FSL 1795 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.05 Range: 25.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR RErt
D e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

8/21/2011
WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25 reached total depth on August 21, 2011
with Frontier Rig 4 at 6,247 feet. The rig was moved off location on August

24, 2011. Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Christopher Noonan 303 563-5377 Production Technician

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAS7E6DE55IGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. MIDDLE MESA

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Viell MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street Ste 1900S , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685 E×t SOUTH PINE RIDGE

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SAN JUAN

1873 FSL 1795 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.05 Range: 25.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR RErt
D e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

8/21/2011
WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25 reached total depth on August 21, 2011
with Frontier Rig 4 at 6,247 feet. The rig was moved off location on August

24, 2011. Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Christopher Noonan 303 563-5377 Production Technician

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



STATE OF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator: Patara Oil & Gas LLC Operator Account Number: N 3670

Address: 600 17th Street, Suite 1900S

city Denver

state CO zip 80202 Phone Number: (303) 825-0685

Well 1

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
4303731907 Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25 NWSE 31 29S 25E San Juan

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

8/9/2011

Comments: Please assign thiswell to the Middle Mesa Unit. The well is targetingthe Honaker Trail Formation.

weiAPI
Numter Well Name QQ Se Twp rt C nty

Action Code Current Erttity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

weiAPI
Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments: NECEIVED
AUS15 201;

ACTION CODES:
017OFOIL S&MINING

A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) Christopher A. Noonan
B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unitwell) Name (Please rint)

C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existingentity
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity signature
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) Production Technician 8/10/2011

Title Date

STATE OF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator: Patara Oil & Gas LLC Operator Account Number: N 3670

Address: 600 17th Street, Suite 1900S

city Denver

state CO zip 80202 Phone Number: (303) 825-0685

Well 1

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
4303731907 Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25 NWSE 31 29S 25E San Juan

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

8/9/2011

Comments: Please assign thiswell to the Middle Mesa Unit. The well is targetingthe Honaker Trail Formation.

weiAPI
Numter Well Name QQ Se Twp rt C nty

Action Code Current Erttity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

weiAPI
Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments: NECEIVED
AUS15 201;

ACTION CODES:
017OFOIL S&MINING

A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) Christopher A. Noonan
B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unitwell) Name (Please rint)

C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existingentity
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity signature
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) Production Technician 8/10/2011

Title Date



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-76335 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 MIDDLE MESA 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC

9. API NUMBER:
 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 600 17th Street Ste 1900S , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 SOUTH PINE RIDGE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1873 FSL 1795 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.0S Range: 25.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 SAN JUAN 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

9/2/2011

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Please find the attached monthly drilling update for the subject well. Thank
you.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Christopher Noonan 303 563-5377

TITLE
 Production Technician

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 9/2/2011

09/09/2011

Sep. 02, 2011

Sundry Number: 18131 API Well Number: 43037319070000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAS7E6DE55IGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. MIDDLE MESA

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Viell MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street Ste 1900S , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685 E×t SOUTH PINE RIDGE

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SAN JUAN

1873 FSL 1795 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.05 Range: 25.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR RErt
D e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

9/2/2011
WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please find the attached monthly drilling update for the subject well. Thank
you.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Christopher Noonan 303 563-5377 Production Technician

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAS7E6DE55IGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. MIDDLE MESA

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Viell MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street Ste 1900S , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685 E×t SOUTH PINE RIDGE

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SAN JUAN

1873 FSL 1795 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.05 Range: 25.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR RErt
D e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

9/2/2011
WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please find the attached monthly drilling update for the subject well. Thank
you.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Christopher Noonan 303 563-5377 Production Technician

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL NAME CONTRACTOR
T.D. AT REPORT FOOTAGE   CUM. DRLG. HRS.
PRESENT OPERATION   CUM. DAYS (FROM SPUD) 0

TIME BREAKDOWS
Drilling Trips Surveys Rig Repair
PU tools Circ Rig service NU BOP
WOC WOC BOP MI&RU
BIT SUMMARY

Footage Condition
Bit No. Size Make Type Serial No. Depth In Depth Out Drilled T B G Ft/Hr

SURVEYS:
MUD PROPERTIES
Mud Wt. Vis WL Fltr Ck /32         pH Oil% Water, %
PV YP Gels Alkilinity, ppm Salt #/bbl
Solids %Sand calcium, ppm Chlorides Other
Mud mixed last 24 hrs.

DRILLING ASSEMBLY
BHA

W.O.B.  RPM PSI GPM AVDP/AVDC

Pump #1: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM
Pump #2: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM Date of B.O.P. Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA

DAILY COSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road & Location (gravel) Mud
Rig Cost Trucking-Mud
Fuel Trucking
Casing (Surface) Super.
Cementing Mud Logging
Bits Geologist
Downhole Rental Pason
Directional Equipment Closed Loop
Sur, Rentals Liv, Qtrs,
Directional W/H equipment
Hot Shot Casing crew
Water Float equipment
Mob/demob Welding & Misc,
Communication Total Cost

DETAILS:

Tear Down Move Rig To New Location Set In Equipment and camps and drill mud Chemicals.
WestRoc Trucking 14 Hrs, Rig Down Move & Rig Up On New Loc,
Ready Derrick spool on drill line, Hook up Electrical lines, Raise derrick, Rig Up Mud Tanks, Pumps 
Rig floor, Fill rig water tanks & pits w/ 1100 bbl's fresh water,
Install new rotary table (8 hr's ) Start dressing conductor to weld on.

Report by Steve Record Date August 9, 2011

24.00

6:00 18:00

12.00

Total

12.00

6:00

Start

18:00

End Hrs

5 1/2
5 1/2

PLANTSERVICES

Welding on Conductor pipe.
0

Patara Oil & Gas  Middle Mesa Fed,  31-33-29-25 / API# 43-037-31907 Frontier #4
0

Size

Fresh water

Hours

98

Nozzle

24

Rotating

8.3

Sep. 02, 2011

Sundry Number: 18131 API Well Number: 43037319070000

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ APl# 43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier#4
T.D.ATREPORT FOOTAGE 0 CUM.DRLG.HRS. O
PRESENTOPERATION Weldingon Conductorpipe. CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 0

TIMEBREAKDOWS
Drilling Trips Surveys RigRepair
PUtools Circ Rigservice NUBOP
WOC WOC BOP Ml&RU 24

BITSUMMARY
Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition

BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.3 Vis WL FltrCk /32 pH Oil% Water,% 98

PV YP Gels Alkilinity,ppm Salt #/bbl

Solids %Sand calcium,ppm Chlorides Other
Mudmixedlast24 hrs. Freshwater

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA

W.0.B. RPM PSI GPM AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM

Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM Dateof B.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hourson BHA

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road&Location(gravel) Mud
RigCost Trucking-Mud

Fuel Trucking
Casing(Surface) Super.
Cementing Mud Logging

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
DirectionalEquipment ClosedLoop
Sur,Rentals Liv,Qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment
HotShot Casingcrew
Water Floatequipment
Mob/demob Welding &Misc,

Communication Total Cost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 18:00 12.00 Tear DownMoveRigTo NewLocationSet InEquipmentand campsand drillmudChemicals.

WestRoc Trucking14 Hrs, Rig DownMove& Rig UpOn New Loc,
18:00 6:00 12.00 Ready Derrickspoolon drillline, Hookup Electricallines, Raise derrick,Rig UpMudTanks, Pumps

Rigfloor,Fillrigwatertanks&pitswl1100bbl'sfreshwater,
Installnewrotarytable (8 hr's) Startdressingconductorto weldon.

Total 24.00

Reportby SteveRecord Date August9,

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ APl# 43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier#4
T.D.ATREPORT FOOTAGE 0 CUM.DRLG.HRS. O
PRESENTOPERATION Weldingon Conductorpipe. CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 0

TIMEBREAKDOWS
Drilling Trips Surveys RigRepair
PUtools Circ Rigservice NUBOP
WOC WOC BOP Ml&RU 24

BITSUMMARY
Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition

BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.3 Vis WL FltrCk /32 pH Oil% Water,% 98

PV YP Gels Alkilinity,ppm Salt #/bbl

Solids %Sand calcium,ppm Chlorides Other
Mudmixedlast24 hrs. Freshwater

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA

W.0.B. RPM PSI GPM AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM

Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM Dateof B.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hourson BHA

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE

Road&Location(gravel) Mud
RigCost Trucking-Mud

Fuel Trucking

Casing(Surface) Super.

Cementing Mud Logging

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
DirectionalEquipment ClosedLoop

Sur,Rentals Liv,Qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment

HotShot Casingcrew
Water Floatequipment
Mob/demob Welding &Misc,

Communication Total Cost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 18:00 12.00 Tear DownMoveRigTo NewLocationSet InEquipmentand campsand drillmudChemicals.

WestRoc Trucking14 Hrs, Rig DownMove& Rig UpOn New Loc,
18:00 6:00 12.00 Ready Derrickspoolon drillline, Hookup Electricallines, Raise derrick,Rig UpMudTanks, Pumps

Rigfloor,Fillrigwatertanks&pitswl1100bbl'sfreshwater,
Installnewrotarytable (8 hr's) Startdressingconductorto weldon.

Total 24.00

Reportby SteveRecord Date August9,



DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL NAME CONTRACTOR
T.D. AT REPORT FOOTAGE   CUM. DRLG. HRS.
PRESENT OPERATION   CUM. DAYS (FROM SPUD) 0

TIME BREAKDOWNS
Drilling Trips Surveys Rig Repair
PU tools Circ Rig service NU BOP
WOC WOC BOP MI&RU
BIT SUMMARY

Footage Condition
Bit No. Size Make Type Serial No. Depth In Depth Out Drilled T B G Ft/Hr

1 50 252 36.0

SURVEYS:
MUD PROPERTIES
Mud Wt. Vis WL Fltr Ck /32         pH Oil% Water, %
PV YP Gels Alkalinity, ppm Salt #/bbl
Solids %Sand calcium, ppm Chlorides Other
Mud mixed last 24 hrs.

DRILLING ASSEMBLY
BHA

W.O.B.  RPM PSI GPM AVDP/AVDC

Pump #1: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM
Pump #2: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM Date of B.O.P. Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA

DAILY COSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road & Location (gravel) Mud
Rig Cost Trucking-Mud
Fuel Trucking
Casing (Surface) Super.
Cementing Mud Logging
Bits Geologist
Down hole Rental Pason
Directional Equipment Closed Loop
Sur, Rentals Liv, Qtrs,
Directional W/H equipment
Hot Shot Casing crew
Water Float equipment
Mob/demob Welding & Misc,
Communication Total Cost

DETAILS:

Dress conductor and weld up
RU, Set catwalk and pipe racks
Lost Hydraulic pump, Work on Hydraulic system and Trouble shot Wait on New pump and rig up 
Change out #1 pumps Liners from 5 1/2" to 6 1/2" (2 hrs)
Ru, install new Hydraulic pump, Pre spud test pumps, and check for leaks on string out Geronimo line.
PU Bit #1 12.25" Mtr, and shock sub Tagged cement @ 50'
Spud MMF 31-33 @ 21:30 Drill cement f/ 50' t/ 60' and formation f/ 60' t/ 120'
PU / Mwd tool and orientated tools
Drill f/ 120' t/ 302'

Report by Steve Record Date

RMB
Hours

Nozzle

CD517
Size

305770

800

PLANTSERVICES

Drilling Surface @ 302'

Frontier #4
252

Patara Oil & Gas  Middle Mesa Fed,  31-33-29-25 / API# 43-037-31907
7.5

98

3X20

8.3 28

10
1

4

756 1/2

12 1/4 Bit -1.50 =1-8" motor-27.42=1-8"-F Sub- 3.00 = 1-8"Shock Sub-9.80 = 1-8"ubho, -2.44= 1-8"nmdc-28.97 = 1-8" nmdc- 30.74

5672825

Rotating

12.25 7

7.5 1.5

2-8" dc,-60.19 = 1-4 1/2 xh- to - 6 5/8 reg x/o sub-3.00 = 3- 6 2/5 - dc- 92.00 = 259.06 ft,

5 1/2 100

0:30

2.00
1.50

Start Hrs

1:30
1:30 1.00

18:00

7:00 8:00

20:00
21:30
0:30

4.50

6:00

18:00

1.00

10.00

6:00

8:00

7:00

20:00
21:30

1.00

August 10, 2011

End

Total 24.00

3.00

Sep. 02, 2011

Sundry Number: 18131 API Well Number: 43037319070000

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ APl# 43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier#4
T.D.ATREPORT FOOTAGE 252 CUM.DRLG.HRS. 7.5
PRESENTOPERATION DrillingSurface@ 302' CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 0

TIMEBREAKDOWNS
Drilling 7.5 Trips 1.5 Surveys RigRepair 10

PUtools 1 Circ Rigservice NUBOP
WOC WOC BOP Ml&RU 4

BITSUMMARY
Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition

BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr
1 12.25 RMB CD517 305770 50 252 7 3X20 36.0

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.3 Vis 28 WL FltrCk /32 pH Oil% Water,% 98

PV YP Gels Alkalinity,ppm Salt #/bbl

Solids %Sand calcium,ppm Chlorides Other
Mudmixedlast24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 12 1/4Bit-1.50=1-8" motor-27.42=1-8"-FSub-3.00 = 1-8"ShockSub-9.80= 1-8"ubho,-2.44=1-8"nmdc-28.97= 1-8"nmdc-30.74
2-8"dc,-60.19= 1-4 1/2 xh-to - 6 5/8 regxlosub-3.00= 3-6 2/5- de-92.00 = 259.06ft,

W.0.B. 25 RPM 28 PSI 800 GPM 567 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 6 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 75
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 100 Dateof B.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hourson BHA

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road&Location(gravel) Mud
RigCost Trucking-Mud

Fuel Trucking
Casing(Surface) Super.
Cementing Mud Logging

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
DirectionalEquipment ClosedLoop
Sur,Rentals Liv,Qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment
HotShot Casingcrew
Water Floatequipment
Mob/demob Welding &Misc,

Communication Total Cost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 7:00 1.00 Dressconductorand weldup
7:00 8:00 1.00 RU,Set catwalkand piperacks
8:00 18:00 10.00 Lost Hydraulicpump,Workon Hydraulicsystemand Trouble shotWait on New pumpand rigup

Changeout#1 pumpsLinersfrom5 1/2" to 6 1/2" (2hrs)
18:00 20:00 2.00 Ru,installnewHydraulicpump,Pre spudtest pumps,and checkforleakson stringoutGeronimoline.
20:00 21:30 1.50 PUBit#1 12.25" Mtr,and shocksub Tagged cement@ 50'
21:30 0:30 3.00 SpudMMF31-33@ 21:30 Drillcementfl 50' tl 60' and formationfl 60't/ 120'
0:30 1:30 1.00 PU/ Mwdtooland orientatedtools
1:30 6:00 4.50 Drillfl120' tl 302'

Total 24.00

Reportby SteveRecord Date August10,

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ APl# 43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier#4
T.D.ATREPORT FOOTAGE 252 CUM.DRLG.HRS. 7.5
PRESENTOPERATION DrillingSurface@ 302' CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 0

TIMEBREAKDOWNS
Drilling 7.5 Trips 1.5 Surveys RigRepair 10

PUtools 1 Circ Rigservice NUBOP
WOC WOC BOP Ml&RU 4

BITSUMMARY
Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition

BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr
1 12.25 RMB CD517 305770 50 252 7 3X20 36.0

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.3 Vis 28 WL FltrCk /32 pH Oil% Water,% 98

PV YP Gels Alkalinity,ppm Salt #/bbl

Solids %Sand calcium,ppm Chlorides Other
Mudmixedlast24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 12 1/4Bit-1.50=1-8" motor-27.42=1-8"-FSub-3.00 = 1-8"ShockSub-9.80= 1-8"ubho,-2.44=1-8"nmdc-28.97= 1-8"nmdc-30.74
2-8"dc,-60.19= 1-4 1/2 xh-to - 6 5/8 regxlosub-3.00= 3-6 2/5- de-92.00 = 259.06ft,

W.0.B. 25 RPM 28 PSI 800 GPM 567 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 6 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 75
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 100 Dateof B.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hourson BHA

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE

Road&Location(gravel) Mud
RigCost Trucking-Mud

Fuel Trucking

Casing(Surface) Super.

Cementing Mud Logging

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
DirectionalEquipment ClosedLoop

Sur,Rentals Liv,Qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment

HotShot Casingcrew
Water Floatequipment
Mob/demob Welding &Misc,

Communication Total Cost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 7:00 1.00 Dressconductorand weldup
7:00 8:00 1.00 RU,Set catwalkand piperacks
8:00 18:00 10.00 Lost Hydraulicpump,Workon Hydraulicsystemand Trouble shotWait on New pumpand rigup

Changeout#1 pumpsLinersfrom5 1/2" to 6 1/2" (2hrs)
18:00 20:00 2.00 Ru,installnewHydraulicpump,Pre spudtest pumps,and checkforleakson stringoutGeronimoline.
20:00 21:30 1.50 PUBit#1 12.25" Mtr,and shocksub Tagged cement@ 50'
21:30 0:30 3.00 SpudMMF31-33@ 21:30 Drillcementfl 50' tl 60' and formationfl 60't/ 120'
0:30 1:30 1.00 PU/ Mwdtooland orientatedtools
1:30 6:00 4.50 Drillfl120' tl 302'

Total 24.00

Reportby SteveRecord Date August10,



DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL NAME CONTRACTOR
T.D. AT REPORT FOOTAGE   CUM. DRLG. HRS.
PRESENT OPERATION   CUM. DAYS (FROM SPUD) 1

TIME BREAKDOWNS
Drilling Trips Surveys Rig Repair
PU tools Circ Rig service NU BOP
WOC WOC BOP MI&RU
BIT SUMMARY

Footage Condition
Bit No. Size Make Type Serial No. Depth In Depth Out Drilled T B G Ft/Hr

1 50 1324 36.0

SURVEYS:
MUD PROPERTIES
Mud Wt. Vis WL Fltr Ck /32         pH 9.50 Oil% Water, %
PV YP Gels Alkalinity, ppm Salt #/bbl
Solids %Sand calcium, ppm Chlorides Other
Mud mixed last 24 hrs.

DRILLING ASSEMBLY
BHA

W.O.B.  RPM PSI GPM AVDP/AVDC

Pump #1: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM
Pump #2: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM Date of B.O.P. Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA

DAILY COSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road & Location (gravel) Mud
Rig Cost Trucking-Mud
Fuel Trucking
Casing (Surface) Super.
Cementing Mud Logging
Bits Geologist
Down hole Rental Pason
Directional Equipment Closed Loop
Sur, Rentals Liv, Qtrs,
Directional W/H equipment
Hot Shot Casing crew
Water Float equipment
Mob/demob Welding & Misc, Inspec
Communication Total Cost

DETAILS:

Drill & Slide f/ 302' t/ 735' 
Rig Service
Drill & Slide f/ 735' t/ 995' 
Work on #2 pump Pop-off Replace 
Drill & Slide f/ 995' t/ 1105'
Circulate Hi vis sweep around 
Drill & Slide f/ 1105' t/ 1199'
Circulate pump catch tank volume back to mud pits heavey sand blinding off screens
Drill & Slide f/ 1199' to 1324' survey @ 1128' 26.6 inc, azm 261.5 tvd 1199'
Install corrosion ring in 1jt above HWDP.
PU 79-K ROT 70-K SO 60

Report by Steve Record Date August 11, 2011

0.50
3.00

10.0016:00

6:00

1:00 2.00
0.50

1:30
2:30
3:00

1.00
0.50

24.00

6:00

6.00
0.50

Total

16:30

3:00

EndStart

1:00

16:00

Hrs

16:30

1:30

23:00

2:30

22:30
22:30
23:00

2 8" dc 59.37/ 1 6 5/8" x 4 1/2" xo 2.68/ 6 6" dc 184.59/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp 737.84'/ total bha 1097.87'
3 STDS DP 190.52 KELLY DOWN 38' = 1324.96'

1763

98

6 1/2 80
5 1/2 100

nov carb c 24sks/ nov phpa 11 pails,

5672842

12.25" bit 1.00'/ 1 Mtr 28.87'/ 1 8" shock sub 9.73'/ 1 8" nmpc 8.38/ 1 8" ubho 2.69/ 1 8" nmdc 30.74/ 1 8" nmdc 30.48'

188.5 33

Frontier #4
29

Hours
7

0.5

Rotating Nozzle
Size

3X20

0.522

12.25 CD517

PLANTSERVICES

Drilling @ 1324'
1022'

Patara Oil & Gas  Middle Mesa Fed,  31-33-29-25 / API# 43-037-31907

305770

1

RMB

Sep. 02, 2011

Sundry Number: 18131 API Well Number: 43037319070000

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ APl# 43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier#4
T.D.ATREPORT FOOTAGE 1022' CUM.DRLG.HRS. 29
PRESENTOPERATION Drilling@ 1324' CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 1

TIMEBREAKDOWNS
Drilling 22 Trips Surveys RigRepair 0.5
PUtools Circ 1 Rigservice 0.5 NUBOP
WOC WOC BOP Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY
Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition

BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr
1 12.25 RMB CD517 305770 50 1324 7 3X20 36.0

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.5 vis 33 WL 18 FltrCk /32 pH 9.50 oli% water,% 98

PV YP Gels Alkalinity,ppm Salt #lbbl
Solids %Sand calcium,ppm Chlorides Other
Mudmixed last24 hrs. novcarbc 24sks/ novphpa 11 pails,

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 12.25" bit1.00'l1 Mtr28.8TIl 8"shocksub 9.73'l1 8"nmpc8.38/1 8"ubho2.69/l 8"nmdc30.74/1 8"nmde30.48'
2 8" de 59.37/ 1 6 5/8"x 4 1/2"xo2.68/ 6 6" de 184.59/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp737.84'/ totalbha 1097.8T
3 STDSDP 190.52 KELLYDOWN38' = 1324.96'
W.0.B. 42 RPM 28 PSI 1763 GPM 567 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 6 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 80
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 100 Dateof B.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hourson BHA

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road&Location(gravel) Mud
RigCost Trucking-Mud

Fuel Trucking
Casing(Surface) Super.
Cementing Mud Logging

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
Directional Equipment ClosedLoop

Sur,Rentals Liv,Qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment
HotShot Casingcrew
Water Floatequipment
Mob/demob Welding&Misc,Inspec
Communication TotalCost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 16:00 10.00 Drill&Slidefl 302'tl 735'
l6:00 16:30 0.50 RigService
16:30 22:30 6.00 Drill&Slidefl735' tl 995'
22:30 23:00 0.50 Workon#2 pumpPop-off Replace
23:00 1:00 2.00 Drill&Slidef/995'tl 1105'
1:00 1:30 0.50 CirculateHivis sweeparound
1:30 2:30 1.00 Drill&Slidef/ ll05' t/ ll99'
2:30 3:00 0.50 Circulatepumpcatchtankvolumeback to mudpitsheavey sand blindingoffscreens
3:00 6:00 3.00 Drill&Slidefl1199' to 1324' survey@ 1128' 26.6 inc, azm261.5 tvd1199'

Installcorrosionringin ljt aboveHWDP.
PU79-KROT70-KSO60

Total 24.00

Report by SteveRecord Date August 11,

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ APl# 43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier#4
T.D.ATREPORT FOOTAGE 1022' CUM.DRLG.HRS. 29
PRESENTOPERATION Drilling@ 1324' CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 1

TIMEBREAKDOWNS
Drilling 22 Trips Surveys RigRepair 0.5
PUtools Circ 1 Rigservice 0.5 NUBOP
WOC WOC BOP Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY
Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition

BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr
1 12.25 RMB CD517 305770 50 1324 7 3X20 36.0

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.5 vis 33 WL 18 FltrCk /32 pH 9.50 oli% water,% 98

PV YP Gels Alkalinity,ppm Salt #lbbl
Solids %Sand calcium,ppm Chlorides Other
Mudmixed last24 hrs. novcarbc 24sks/ novphpa 11 pails,

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 12.25" bit1.00'l1 Mtr28.8TIl 8"shocksub 9.73'l1 8"nmpc8.38/1 8"ubho2.69/l 8"nmdc30.74/1 8"nmde30.48'
2 8" de 59.37/ 1 6 5/8"x 4 1/2"xo2.68/ 6 6" de 184.59/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp737.84'/ totalbha 1097.8T
3 STDSDP 190.52 KELLYDOWN38' = 1324.96'
W.0.B. 42 RPM 28 PSI 1763 GPM 567 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 6 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 80
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 100 Dateof B.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hourson BHA

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE

Road&Location(gravel) Mud
RigCost Trucking-Mud

Fuel Trucking

Casing(Surface) Super.

Cementing Mud Logging

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
Directional Equipment ClosedLoop

Sur,Rentals Liv,Qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment

HotShot Casingcrew
Water Floatequipment
Mob/demob Welding&Misc,Inspec
Communication TotalCost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 16:00 10.00 Drill&Slidefl 302'tl 735'
l6:00 16:30 0.50 RigService
16:30 22:30 6.00 Drill&Slidefl735' tl 995'
22:30 23:00 0.50 Workon#2 pumpPop-off Replace
23:00 1:00 2.00 Drill&Slidef/995'tl 1105'
1:00 1:30 0.50 CirculateHivis sweeparound
1:30 2:30 1.00 Drill&Slidef/ ll05' t/ ll99'
2:30 3:00 0.50 Circulatepumpcatchtankvolumeback to mudpitsheavey sand blindingoffscreens
3:00 6:00 3.00 Drill&Slidefl1199' to 1324' survey@ 1128' 26.6 inc, azm261.5 tvd1199'

Installcorrosionringin ljt aboveHWDP.
PU79-KROT70-KSO60

Total 24.00

Report by SteveRecord Date August 11,



DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL NAME CONTRACTOR
T.D. AT REPORT FOOTAGE   CUM. DRLG. HRS.
PRESENT OPERATION   CUM. DAYS (FROM SPUD) 2

TIME BREAKDOWNS
Drilling Trips Other Rig Repair
PU tools Circ Rig service NU BOP
WOC WOC BOP MI&RU
BIT SUMMARY

Footage Condition
Bit No. Size Make Type Serial No. Depth In Depth Out Drilled T B G Ft/Hr

1 50 1941 36.0

SURVEYS:
MUD PROPERTIES
Mud Wt. Vis WL Fltr Ck 18 /32         pH 9.50 Oil% Water, %
PV YP Gels Alkalinity, ppm Salt #/bbl
Solids %Sand calcium, ppm Chlorides Other
Mud mixed last 24 hrs.

DRILLING ASSEMBLY
BHA

W.O.B.  RPM PSI GPM AVDP/AVDC

Pump #1: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM
Pump #2: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM Date of B.O.P. Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA

DAILY COSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road & Location (gravel) Mud
Rig Cost Trucking-Mud
Fuel Trucking
Casing (Surface) Super.
Cementing Mud Logging
Bits Geologist
Down hole Rental Pason
Directional Equipment Closed Loop
Sur, Rentals Liv, Qtrs,
Directional W/H equipment
Hot Shot Casing crew
Water Float equipment
Mob/demob Welding & Misc, Inspect
Communication Total Cost

DETAILS:

Drill & Slide f/ 1324' t/ 1707'
Rig Service
Drill & Slide f/ 1707' t/ 1991'
Stuck in hole making connection driller pulled 80-k over string wt and stuck pipe,
Thought it could be Differentially stuck also pumped 30bbls diesel to check for differential sticking no release of pipe, 
Mud up with gel to 46 vis, work pipe and wait for surface jars.

PU 105-K ROT 84-K SO 62-K

Report by Steve Record Date

PLANTSERVICES

Working stuck pipe @ 1959'
0

Patara Oil & Gas  Middle Mesa Fed,  31-33-29-25 / API# 43-037-31907 Frontier #4
40.5

Rotating

0.5

Hours
40.5

Nozzle

12.25 RMB 305770

11.5 12

Size
3X20CD517

988.6 42

2 8" dc 59.37/ 1 6 5/8" x 4 1/2" xo 2.68/ 6 6" dc 184.59/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp 737.84'/ total bha 1097.87'
13 STDS DP 825.58 & 1 SINGLE 31.97' KELLY DOWN 38' = 1991.42'

3 2/3
1 1000

3 0.01

1763
6 1/2 80
5 1/2

610

18

2842

12.25" bit 1.00'/ 1 Mtr 28.87'/ 1 8" shock sub 9.73'/ 1 8" nmpc 8.38/ 1 8" ubho 2.69/ 1 8" nmdc 30.74/ 1 8" nmdc 30.48'

6.00

100

18:00

EndStart

12:00
12:0011:30

6:00 5.50

24.00Total

12.00

Hrs

6:00

0.50
18:00

11:30

August 12, 2011

Sep. 02, 2011

Sundry Number: 18131 API Well Number: 43037319070000

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ APl# 43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier#4
T.D.ATREPORT FOOTAGE 0 CUM.DRLG.HRS. 40.5
PRESENTOPERATION Workingstuckpipe@ 1959' CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 2

TIMEBREAKDOWNS
Drilling 11.5 Trips Other 12 RigRepair
PUtools Circ Rigservice 0.5 NUBOP
WOC WOC BOP Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY
Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition

BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr
1 12.25 RMB CD517 305770 50 1941 40.5 3X20 36.0

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.6 vis 42 WL 18 FltrCk 18 /32 pH 9.50 oli% water,% 98

PV 3 YP 3 Gels 2/3 Alkalinity,ppm 0.01 Salt #lbbl
Solids 1 %Sand calcium,ppm Chlorides 1000 Other
Mudmixed last24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 12.25" bit1.00'l1 Mtr28.8TIl 8"shocksub 9.73'l1 8"nmpc8.38/1 8"ubho2.69/l 8"nmdc30.74/1 8"nmde30.48'
2 8" de 59.37/ 1 6 5/8"x 4 1/2"xo2.68/ 6 6" de 184.59/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp737.84'/ totalbha 1097.8T
13 STDSDP 825.58 &1 SINGLE31.9TKELLYDOWN38' = 1991.42'
W.0.B. 42 RPM 28 PSI 1763 GPM 610 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 6 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 80
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 100 Dateof B.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hourson BHA

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road&Location(gravel) Mud
RigCost Trucking-Mud

Fuel Trucking
Casing(Surface) Super.
Cementing Mud Logging

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
Directional Equipment ClosedLoop

Sur,Rentals Liv,Qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment
HotShot Casingcrew
Water Floatequipment
Mob/demob Welding&Misc,Inspect
Communication TotalCost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 11:30 5.50 Drill&Slidef/1324't/170T
ll:30 12:00 0.50 RigService
12:00 18:00 6.00 Drill&Slidefl170T tl1991'
18:00 6:00 12.00 Stuckin hole makingconnectiondrillerpulled80-koverstringwt and stuckpipe,

Thought itcouldbe Differentiallystuckalsopurnped30bb|sdieselto checkfor differentialstickingno release ofpipe,
Mudupwithgelto 46 vis, work pipeandwait for surfacejars.

PU105-KROT84-KSO62-K

Total 24.00

Report by SteveRecord Date August 12,

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ APl# 43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier#4
T.D.ATREPORT FOOTAGE 0 CUM.DRLG.HRS. 40.5
PRESENTOPERATION Workingstuckpipe@ 1959' CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 2

TIMEBREAKDOWNS
Drilling 11.5 Trips Other 12 RigRepair
PUtools Circ Rigservice 0.5 NUBOP
WOC WOC BOP Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY
Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition

BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr
1 12.25 RMB CD517 305770 50 1941 40.5 3X20 36.0

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.6 vis 42 WL 18 FltrCk 18 /32 pH 9.50 oli% water,% 98

PV 3 YP 3 Gels 2/3 Alkalinity,ppm 0.01 Salt #lbbl
Solids 1 %Sand calcium,ppm Chlorides 1000 Other
Mudmixed last24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 12.25" bit1.00'l1 Mtr28.8TIl 8"shocksub 9.73'l1 8"nmpc8.38/1 8"ubho2.69/l 8"nmdc30.74/1 8"nmde30.48'
2 8" de 59.37/ 1 6 5/8"x 4 1/2"xo2.68/ 6 6" de 184.59/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp737.84'/ totalbha 1097.8T
13 STDSDP 825.58 &1 SINGLE31.9TKELLYDOWN38' = 1991.42'
W.0.B. 42 RPM 28 PSI 1763 GPM 610 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 6 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 80
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 100 Dateof B.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hourson BHA

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE

Road&Location(gravel) Mud
RigCost Trucking-Mud

Fuel Trucking

Casing(Surface) Super.

Cementing Mud Logging

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
Directional Equipment ClosedLoop

Sur,Rentals Liv,Qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment

HotShot Casingcrew
Water Floatequipment
Mob/demob Welding&Misc,Inspect
Communication TotalCost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 11:30 5.50 Drill&Slidef/1324't/170T
ll:30 12:00 0.50 RigService
12:00 18:00 6.00 Drill&Slidefl170T tl1991'
18:00 6:00 12.00 Stuckin hole makingconnectiondrillerpulled80-koverstringwt and stuckpipe,

Thought itcouldbe Differentiallystuckalsopurnped30bb|sdieselto checkfor differentialstickingno release ofpipe,
Mudupwithgelto 46 vis, work pipeandwait for surfacejars.

PU105-KROT84-KSO62-K

Total 24.00

Report by SteveRecord Date August 12,



DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL NAME CONTRACTOR
T.D. AT REPORT FOOTAGE   CUM. DRLG. HRS.
PRESENT OPERATION   CUM. DAYS (FROM SPUD) 3

TIME BREAKDOWNS
Drilling Trips Fishing Rig Repair
PU tools Circ Rig service NU BOP
WOC WOC BOP MI&RU
BIT SUMMARY

Footage Condition
Bit No. Size Make Type Serial No. Depth In Depth Out Drilled T B G Ft/Hr

1 50 1941 47.9

SURVEYS:
MUD PROPERTIES
Mud Wt. Vis WL Fltr Ck 18 /32         pH 9.50 Oil% Water, %
PV YP Gels Alkalinity, ppm Salt #/bbl
Solids %Sand calcium, ppm Chlorides MBT
Mud mixed last 24 hrs.

DRILLING ASSEMBLY
BHA

W.O.B.  RPM PSI GPM AVDP/AVDC

Pump #1: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM
Pump #2: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM Date of B.O.P. Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA

DAILY COSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road & Location (gravel) Mud
Rig Cost Trucking-Mud
Fuel Trucking
Casing (Surface) Super.
Cementing Mud Logging
Bits Geologist
Down hole Rental Pason
Directional Equipment Closed Loop
Sur, Rentals Liv, Qtrs,
Directional W/H equipment
Hot Shot Casing crew
Water Float equipment
Mob/demob Welding & Misc, Inspect
Communication Total Cost

DETAILS:

Work stuck pipe wait on fishing tools and wire line
Rig Service
Held safety meeting w / crews and Rig up surface jars and attempt to jar free stuck pipe w 150-k down stoke
no movement in pipe, rig down jars and ru wire line and retrieve MWD tool, ran back in to establishes free point @ 1617'
Pull out wait on black magic and a load of diesel, Kelly up circulating w/ rig pump, start mixing Bio-spot treatment. 

Report by Steve Record Date

Total 24.00

August 13, 2011

22:30 6:00 7.50

17:30 18:00 0.50
18:00 22:30 4.50

Start End Hrs
6:00 17:30 11.50

6 1/2 60
5 1/2

12.25" bit 1.00'/ 1 Mtr 28.87'/ 1 8" shock sub 9.73'/ 1 8" nmpc 8.38/ 1 8" ubho 2.69/ 1 8" nmdc 30.74/ 1 8" nmdc 30.48'
2 8" dc 59.37/ 1 6 5/8" x 4 1/2" xo 2.68/ 6 6" dc 184.59/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp 737.84'/ total bha 1097.87'
13 STDS DP 825.58 & 1 SINGLE 31.97' KELLY DOWN 38' = 1991.42'

0 0 266 220

10 5 1/3 0.01
1 .025 10,000 10

8.6 42 18 97

Rotating Nozzle
Hours Size

12.25 RMB CD517 305770 40.5 3X20

Mixing Black Magic Spotting fluid

24

PLANTSERVICES

Patara Oil & Gas  Middle Mesa Fed,  31-33-29-25 / API# 43-037-31907 Frontier #4
0 40.5

Sep. 02, 2011

Sundry Number: 18131 API Well Number: 43037319070000

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ APl# 43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier#4
T.D.ATREPORT FOOTAGE 0 CUM.DRLG.HRS. 40.5
PRESENTOPERATION MixingBlackMagicSpottingfluid CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 3

TIMEBREAKDOWNS
Drilling Trips Fishing 24 RigRepair
PUtools Circ Rigservice NUBOP
WOC WOC BOP Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY
Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition

BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr
1 12.25 RMB CD517 305770 50 1941 40.5 3X20 47.9

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.6 vis 42 WL 18 FltrCk 18 /32 pH 9.50 Oil% Water,% 97

Pv 10 YP 5 Gels 1/3 Alkalinity,ppm 0.01 Salt #lbbl
Solids 1 %Sand .025 calcium,ppm Chlorides 10,000 MBT 10
Mudmixed last24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 12.25" bit1.00'l1 Mtr28.8TIl 8"shocksub 9.73'l1 8"nmpc8.38/1 8"ubho2.69/l 8"nmdc30.74/1 8"nmde30.48'
2 8" de 59.37/ 1 6 5/8"x 4 1/2"xo2.68/ 6 6" de 184.59/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp737.84'/ totalbha 1097.8T
13 STDSDP 825.58 &1 SINGLE31.9TKELLYDOWN38' = 1991.42'
W.0.B. O RPM 0 Psi 266 GPM 220 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 6 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 60
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM Dateof B.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hourson BHA

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road&Location(gravel) Mud
RigCost Trucking-Mud

Fuel Trucking
Casing(Surface) Super.
Cementing Mud Logging

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
Directional Equipment ClosedLoop

Sur,Rentals Liv,Qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment
HotShot Casingcrew
Water Floatequipment
Mob/demob Welding&Misc,Inspect
Communication TotalCost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 17:30 11.50 Workstuckpipewait on fishing toolsandwire line
17:30 18:00 0.50 RigService
18:00 22:30 4.50 Heldsafetymeetingwl crewsand Rigup surfacejarsand attempttojarfreestuckpipew 150-k downstoke

no movementin pipe,rigdownjarsand ruwire lineand retrieveMWDtool,ran backin to establishesfree point@ 161T
22:30 6:00 7.50 Pulloutwait on blackmagicand a load ofdiesel,Kellyupcirculatingw/ rigpump,startmixingBio-spottreatment.

Total 24.00

Report by SteveRecord Date August 13,

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ APl# 43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier#4
T.D.ATREPORT FOOTAGE 0 CUM.DRLG.HRS. 40.5
PRESENTOPERATION MixingBlackMagicSpottingfluid CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 3

TIMEBREAKDOWNS
Drilling Trips Fishing 24 RigRepair
PUtools Circ Rigservice NUBOP
WOC WOC BOP Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY
Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition

BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr
1 12.25 RMB CD517 305770 50 1941 40.5 3X20 47.9

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.6 vis 42 WL 18 FltrCk 18 /32 pH 9.50 Oil% Water,% 97

Pv 10 YP 5 Gels 1/3 Alkalinity,ppm 0.01 Salt #lbbl
Solids 1 %Sand .025 calcium,ppm Chlorides 10,000 MBT 10
Mudmixed last24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 12.25" bit1.00'l1 Mtr28.8TIl 8"shocksub 9.73'l1 8"nmpc8.38/1 8"ubho2.69/l 8"nmdc30.74/1 8"nmde30.48'
2 8" de 59.37/ 1 6 5/8"x 4 1/2"xo2.68/ 6 6" de 184.59/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp737.84'/ totalbha 1097.8T
13 STDSDP 825.58 &1 SINGLE31.9TKELLYDOWN38' = 1991.42'
W.0.B. O RPM 0 Psi 266 GPM 220 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 6 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 60
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM Dateof B.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hourson BHA

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE

Road&Location(gravel) Mud
RigCost Trucking-Mud

Fuel Trucking

Casing(Surface) Super.

Cementing Mud Logging

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
Directional Equipment ClosedLoop

Sur,Rentals Liv,Qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment

HotShot Casingcrew
Water Floatequipment
Mob/demob Welding&Misc,Inspect
Communication TotalCost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 17:30 11.50 Workstuckpipewait on fishing toolsandwire line
17:30 18:00 0.50 RigService
18:00 22:30 4.50 Heldsafetymeetingwl crewsand Rigup surfacejarsand attempttojarfreestuckpipew 150-k downstoke

no movementin pipe,rigdownjarsand ruwire lineand retrieveMWDtool,ran backin to establishesfree point@ 161T
22:30 6:00 7.50 Pulloutwait on blackmagicand a load ofdiesel,Kellyupcirculatingw/ rigpump,startmixingBio-spottreatment.

Total 24.00

Report by SteveRecord Date August 13,



DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL NAME CONTRACTOR
T.D. AT REPORT FOOTAGE   CUM. DRLG. HRS.
PRESENT OPERATION Dir. Work MU Bit #2   CUM. DAYS (FROM SPUD) 4

TIME BREAKDOWNS
Drilling Trips Fishing Rig Repair
PU tools Circ Rig service NU BOP
WOC WOC BOP MI&RU
BIT SUMMARY

Footage Condition
Bit No. Size Make Type Serial No. Depth In Depth Out Drilled T B G Ft/Hr

1 50 1991 1941 4/1E/1 47.9
2 1991' 0

SURVEYS:
MUD PROPERTIES
Mud Wt. Vis WL Fltr Ck 2 /32         pH 10.00 Oil% Water, %
PV YP Gels Alkalinity, ppm Salt #/bbl
Solids %Sand calcium, ppm Chlorides MBT
Mud mixed last 24 hrs.

DRILLING ASSEMBLY
BHA

W.O.B.  RPM PSI GPM AVDP/AVDC

Pump #1: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM
Pump #2: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM Date of B.O.P. Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA

DAILY COSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road & Location (gravel) Mud
Rig Cost Trucking-Mud
Fuel Trucking
Casing (Surface) Super.
Cementing Wire Line
Bits Geologist
Down hole Rental Pason
Directional Equipment Closed Loop
Sur, Rentals Liv, Qtrs,
Directional W/H equipment
Hot Shot Casing crew
Water Float equipment
Mob/demob Welding & Misc, Inspect
Communication Total Cost

DETAILS:

Circulate spot 50 bbls of Black Magic around BHA and let soak 4 hrs, set kelly back and pick up 
Surface jars, jarring w/ 150-k down no movement, LD surface jars, RU wire line and ran in hole to
establish free point and back off @ 1615', Inspect Drk after working surface jars (ok)
Trip all dp and hwdp + 1 6" dc  and LD 6" shot connection 
Pu fishing tools, screw in sub, Bumper sub, Hyd- Jars, 24 Jts HWDP, Energizer,  
Kelly & Circulate to top of fish Clear connection, 
Screw in to fish and start jarring w/ 260-k jar 20 times up and fish came free
Trip with fish to 1050' pulled into tight spot up to 150-k.
Kelly up and work through tight spot circulating Sapp and walnut to clear bit balling.
Trip, LD fishing tools, 1 shot 6" DC, and std back BHA break UBHO sub and clean out cuttings,
Break bit and MU bit #2, Dir.work. 

Report by Steve Record Date

Total 24.00

August 14, 2011

23:00 5:00 6.00
5:00 6:00 1.00

19:30 21:30 2.00
21:30 23:00 1.50

18:30 19:00 0.50
19:00 19:30 0.50

14:00 16:00 2.00
16:00 18:30 2.50

Start End Hrs
6:00 14:00 8.00

6 1/2 60
5 1/2

Black Magic & Diesel

12.25" bit 1.00'/ 1 Mtr 28.87'/ 1 8" shock sub 9.73'/ 1 8" nmpc 8.38/ 1 8" ubho 2.69/ 1 8" nmdc 30.74/ 1 8" nmdc 30.48'
2 8" dc 59.37/ 1 6 5/8" x 4 1/2" xo 2.68/ 6 6" dc 184.59/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp 737.84'/ total bha 1097.87'
13 STDS DP 825.58 & 1 SINGLE 31.97' KELLY DOWN 38' = 1991.42'

0 0 266 220

14 13 3/4 0.05
2.5 Trace 12,000 7.5

8.6 38 7 97.5

12.25 RMB CW517GX 171 0 4X18

Hours Size
12.25 RMB CD517G 305770 40.5 3X20

Rotating Nozzle

24

PLANTSERVICES

Patara Oil & Gas  Middle Mesa Fed,  31-33-29-25 / API# 43-037-31907 Frontier #4
0 40.5

Sep. 02, 2011

Sundry Number: 18131 API Well Number: 43037319070000

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ APl# 43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier#4
T.D.ATREPORT FOOTAGE 0 CUM.DRLG.HRS. 40.5
PRESENTOPERATION Dir.WorkMUBit#2 CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 4

TIMEBREAKDOWNS
Drilling Trips Fishing 24 RigRepair
PUtools Circ Rigservice NUBOP
WOC WOC BOP Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY
Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition

BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr
1 12.25 RMB CD517G 305770 50 1991 1941 40.5 3X20 4/1E/1 47.9
2 12.25 RMB CW517GX 171 1991' 0 0 4X18

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.6 vis 38 WL 7 FltrCk 2 /32 pH 10.00 Oil% Water,% 97.5

PV 14 YP 13 Gels 3/4 Alkalinity,ppm 0.05 Salt #lbbl
Solids 2.5 %Sand Trace calcium,ppm Chlorides 12,000 MBT 7.5
Mudmixed last24 hrs. BlackMagic&Diesel

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 12.25" bit1.00'l1 Mtr28.8TIl 8"shocksub 9.73'l1 8"nmpc8.38/1 8"ubho2.69/l 8"nmdc30.74/1 8"nmde30.48'
2 8" de 59.37/ 1 6 5/8"x 4 1/2"xo2.68/ 6 6" de 184.59/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp737.84'/ totalbha 1097.8T
13 STDSDP 825.58 &1 SINGLE31.9TKELLYDOWN38' = 1991.42'
W.0.B. O RPM 0 Psi 266 GPM 220 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 6 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 60
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM Dateof B.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hourson BHA

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road&Location(gravel) Mud
RigCost Trucking-Mud

Fuel Trucking
Casing(Surface) Super.
Cementing Wire Line

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
Directional Equipment ClosedLoop

Sur,Rentals Liv,Qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment
HotShot Casingcrew
Water Floatequipment
Mob/demob Welding&Misc,Inspect
Communication TotalCost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 14:00 8.00 Circulatespot50 bblsof BlackMagicaroundBHAand let soak4 hrs, set kellybackand pickup

Surfacejars,jarringwl150-kdownno movement,LDsurfacejars,RUwirelineand ran inholeto
establishfree pointand backoff@ 1615', InspectDrkafterworkingsurfacejars(ok)

14:00 16:00 2.00 Tripalldp and hwdp + 1 6"de and LD6"shotconnection
16:00 18:30 2.50 Pu fishingtools,screwin sub, Bumper sub, Hyd-Jars, 24 Jts HWDP,Energizer,
18:30 19:00 0.50 Kelly&Circulateto topoffish Clearconnection,
19:00 19:30 0.50 Screwinto fishand startjarringwl260-kjar 20timesupand fishcamefree
19:30 21:30 2.00 Tripwithfishto 1050' pulledintotightspotupto 150-k.

21:30 23:00 1.50 Kellyup and work throughtightspotcirculatingSapp andwalnut to clearbitballing.
23:00 5:00 6.00 Trip, LDfishingtools,1 shot6"DC,and std backBHAbreakUBHOsub and cleanoutcuttings,
5:00 6:00 1.00 Breakbitand MUbit#2, Dir.work.

Total 24.00

Report by SteveRecord Date August 14,

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ APl# 43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier#4
T.D.ATREPORT FOOTAGE 0 CUM.DRLG.HRS. 40.5
PRESENTOPERATION Dir.WorkMUBit#2 CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 4

TIMEBREAKDOWNS
Drilling Trips Fishing 24 RigRepair
PUtools Circ Rigservice NUBOP
WOC WOC BOP Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY
Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition

BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr
1 12.25 RMB CD517G 305770 50 1991 1941 40.5 3X20 4/1E/1 47.9
2 12.25 RMB CW517GX 171 1991' 0 0 4X18

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.6 vis 38 WL 7 FltrCk 2 /32 pH 10.00 Oil% Water,% 97.5

PV 14 YP 13 Gels 3/4 Alkalinity,ppm 0.05 Salt #lbbl
Solids 2.5 %Sand Trace calcium,ppm Chlorides 12,000 MBT 7.5
Mudmixed last24 hrs. BlackMagic&Diesel

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 12.25" bit1.00'l1 Mtr28.8TIl 8"shocksub 9.73'l1 8"nmpc8.38/1 8"ubho2.69/l 8"nmdc30.74/1 8"nmde30.48'
2 8" de 59.37/ 1 6 5/8"x 4 1/2"xo2.68/ 6 6" de 184.59/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp737.84'/ totalbha 1097.8T
13 STDSDP 825.58 &1 SINGLE31.9TKELLYDOWN38' = 1991.42'
W.0.B. O RPM 0 Psi 266 GPM 220 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 6 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 60
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM Dateof B.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hourson BHA

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE

Road&Location(gravel) Mud
RigCost Trucking-Mud

Fuel Trucking

Casing(Surface) Super.

Cementing Wire Line

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
Directional Equipment ClosedLoop

Sur,Rentals Liv,Qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment

HotShot Casingcrew
Water Floatequipment
Mob/demob Welding&Misc,Inspect
Communication TotalCost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 14:00 8.00 Circulatespot50 bblsof BlackMagicaroundBHAand let soak4 hrs, set kellybackand pickup

Surfacejars,jarringwl150-kdownno movement,LDsurfacejars,RUwirelineand ran inholeto
establishfree pointand backoff@ 1615', InspectDrkafterworkingsurfacejars(ok)

14:00 16:00 2.00 Tripalldp and hwdp + 1 6"de and LD6"shotconnection
16:00 18:30 2.50 Pu fishingtools,screwin sub, Bumper sub, Hyd-Jars, 24 Jts HWDP,Energizer,
18:30 19:00 0.50 Kelly&Circulateto topoffish Clearconnection,
19:00 19:30 0.50 Screwinto fishand startjarringwl260-kjar 20timesupand fishcamefree
19:30 21:30 2.00 Tripwithfishto 1050' pulledintotightspotupto 150-k.

21:30 23:00 1.50 Kellyup and work throughtightspotcirculatingSapp andwalnut to clearbitballing.
23:00 5:00 6.00 Trip, LDfishingtools,1 shot6"DC,and std backBHAbreakUBHOsub and cleanoutcuttings,
5:00 6:00 1.00 Breakbitand MUbit#2, Dir.work.

Total 24.00

Report by SteveRecord Date August 14,



DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL NAME CONTRACTOR
T.D. AT REPORT FOOTAGE   CUM. DRLG. HRS.
PRESENT OPERATION Drilling @ 2466'   CUM. DAYS (FROM SPUD) 5

TIME BREAKDOWNS
Drilling Trips Wash & Ream Rig Repair
PU tools Circ Rig service NU BOP
WOC Other BOP MI&RU
BIT SUMMARY

Footage Condition
Bit No. Size Make Type Serial No. Depth In Depth Out Drilled T B G Ft/Hr

1 50 1991 1941 4/1E/1 47.9
2 1991' 475 33.9

SURVEYS:
MUD PROPERTIES
Mud Wt. Vis WL Fltr Ck /32         pH 9.50 Oil% Water, %
PV YP Gels Alkalinity, ppm Salt #/bbl
Solids %Sand calcium, ppm Chlorides MBT
Mud mixed last 24 hrs.

DRILLING ASSEMBLY
BHA

W.O.B.  RPM PSI GPM AVDP/AVDC

Pump #1: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM
Pump #2: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM Date of B.O.P. Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA

DAILY COSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road & Location (gravel) Mud
Rig Cost Trucking-Mud
Fuel Trucking
Casing (Surface) Super.
Cementing Mud Logging
Bits Geologist
Down hole Rental Pason
Directional Equipment Closed Loop
Sur, Rentals Liv, Qtrs,
Directional W/H equipment
Hot Shot Casing crew
Water Float equipment
Mob/demob Welding & Misc, Inspect
Communication Total Cost

DETAILS:

Trip, Dir. Work trip in to 1098' 
Visually inspect derrick, sheaves, shackles and lighting after Jarring down hole.
Rig service
Trip in hole to 1928' 
Wash & Ream f/ 1928' t/ 1991' 
Circulate & Condition mud Displace 277 bbl's from hole clean pits out and fill w/ fresh water
Drill & Slide f/ 1991' t/ 2213' 
Trip 2 std's to retrive pipe screen.
Drill & Slide f/ 2213' t/ 2403'
Change out Pason depth tracer on fast line sheave in crown.
Drill & Slide f/ 2403' t/ 2466'

Report by Steve Record Date

Total 24.00

August 15, 2011

1:30 2:30 1.00
2:30 6:00 3.50

20:30 21:00 0.50
21:00 1:30 4.50

13:00 14:30 1.50
14:30 20:30 6.00

9:00 12:30 3.50
12:30 13:00 0.50

8:00 8:30 0.50
8:30 9:00 0.50

Start End Hrs
6:00 8:00 2.00

6 1/2 80
5 1/2 100

12.25" bit 1.00'/ 1 Mtr 28.87'/ 1 8" shock sub 9.73'/ 1 8" nmpc 8.38/ 1 8" ubho 2.69/ 1 8" nmdc 30.74/ 1 8" nmdc 30.48'
2 8" dc 59.37/ 1 6 5/8" x 4 1/2" xo 2.68/ 6 6" dc 185.54/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp 737.84'/ total bha 1098.82'
13 STDS DP 825.58 & 1 SINGLE 31.97' KELLY DOWN 38' = 1991.42'

0 0 266 610

2364.00', incl 30.40, azm 261.10, tvd 2175.98

8.5 42 16 97.5

12.25 RMB CW517GX 171 14 4X18

Hours Size
12.25 RMB CD517G 305770 40.5 3X20

Rotating Nozzle

14 6 0.5
1.5 0.5

PLANTSERVICES

Patara Oil & Gas  Middle Mesa Fed,  31-33-29-25 / API# 43-037-31907 Frontier #4
475 54.5

1.5

Sep. 02, 2011

Sundry Number: 18131 API Well Number: 43037319070000

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ APl# 43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier#4
T.D.ATREPORT FOOTAGE 475 CUM.DRLG.HRS. 54.5
PRESENTOPERATION Drilling@ 2466' CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 5

TIMEBREAKDOWNS
Drilling 14 Trips 6 Wash& Ream 0.5 RigRepair
PUtools Cire 1.5 Rigservice 0.5 NUBOP
WOC Other 1.5 BOP Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY
Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition

BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr
1 12.25 RMB CD517G 305770 50 1991 1941 40.5 3X20 4/1E/1 47.9
2 12.25 RMB CW517GX 171 1991' 475 14 4X18 33.9

SURVEYS: 2364.00', incl30.40, azm261.10, tvd2175.98
MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.5 vis 42 WL 16 FltrCk /32 pH 9.50 Oil% Water,% 97.5

PV YP Gels Alkalinity,ppm Salt #lbbl
Solids %Sand calcium,ppm Chlorides MBT
Mudmixed last24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 12.25" bit1.00'l1 Mtr28.8TIl 8"shocksub 9.73'l1 8"nmpc8.38/1 8"ubho2.69/l 8"nmdc30.74/1 8"nmde30.48'
2 8" de 59.37/ 1 6 5/8"x 4 1/2"xo2.68/ 6 6" de 185.54/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp737.84'/ totalbha 1098.82'
13 STDSDP 825.58 &1 SINGLE31.9TKELLYDOWN38' = 1991.42'
W.0.B. O RPM 0 Psi 266 GPM 610 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 6 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 80
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 100 Dateof B.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hourson BHA

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road&Location(gravel) Mud
RigCost Trucking-Mud

Fuel Trucking
Casing(Surface) Super.
Cementing Mud Logging

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
Directional Equipment ClosedLoop

Sur,Rentals Liv,Qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment
HotShot Casingcrew
Water Floatequipment
Mob/demob Welding&Misc,Inspect
Communication TotalCost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 8:00 2.00 Trip, Dir.Worktripin to 1098'
8:00 8:30 0.50 Visuallyinspectderrick,sheaves, shacklesand lightingafterJarringdownhole.
8:30 9:00 0.50 Rigservice
9:00 12:30 3.50 Trip in hole to 1928'
12:30 13:00 0.50 Wash &Rearn fl1928' t/ 1991'
13:00 14:30 1.50 Circulate&Conditionrnud Displace 277 bbl'sfrorn hole cleanpitsoutand fillw/ fresh water
14:30 20:30 6.00 Drill&Slidefl1991' tl 2213'
20:30 21:00 0.50 Trip2 std'sto retrivepipescreen.
21:00 1:30 4.50 Drill&Slidefl2213' tl 2403'
1:30 2:30 1.00 ChangeoutPason depthtraceron fast linesheave in crown.
2:30 6:00 3.50 Drill&Slidefl2403'tl 2466'

Total 24.00

Report by SteveRecord Date August 15,

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ APl# 43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier#4
T.D.ATREPORT FOOTAGE 475 CUM.DRLG.HRS. 54.5
PRESENTOPERATION Drilling@ 2466' CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 5

TIMEBREAKDOWNS
Drilling 14 Trips 6 Wash& Ream 0.5 RigRepair
PUtools Cire 1.5 Rigservice 0.5 NUBOP
WOC Other 1.5 BOP Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY
Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition

BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr
1 12.25 RMB CD517G 305770 50 1991 1941 40.5 3X20 4/1E/1 47.9
2 12.25 RMB CW517GX 171 1991' 475 14 4X18 33.9

SURVEYS: 2364.00', incl30.40, azm261.10, tvd2175.98
MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.5 vis 42 WL 16 FltrCk /32 pH 9.50 Oil% Water,% 97.5

PV YP Gels Alkalinity,ppm Salt #lbbl
Solids %Sand calcium,ppm Chlorides MBT
Mudmixed last24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 12.25" bit1.00'l1 Mtr28.8TIl 8"shocksub 9.73'l1 8"nmpc8.38/1 8"ubho2.69/l 8"nmdc30.74/1 8"nmde30.48'
2 8" de 59.37/ 1 6 5/8"x 4 1/2"xo2.68/ 6 6" de 185.54/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp737.84'/ totalbha 1098.82'
13 STDSDP 825.58 &1 SINGLE31.9TKELLYDOWN38' = 1991.42'
W.0.B. O RPM 0 Psi 266 GPM 610 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 6 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 80
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 100 Dateof B.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hourson BHA

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE

Road&Location(gravel) Mud
RigCost Trucking-Mud

Fuel Trucking

Casing(Surface) Super.

Cementing Mud Logging

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
Directional Equipment ClosedLoop

Sur,Rentals Liv,Qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment

HotShot Casingcrew
Water Floatequipment
Mob/demob Welding&Misc,Inspect
Communication TotalCost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 8:00 2.00 Trip, Dir.Worktripin to 1098'
8:00 8:30 0.50 Visuallyinspectderrick,sheaves, shacklesand lightingafterJarringdownhole.
8:30 9:00 0.50 Rigservice
9:00 12:30 3.50 Trip in hole to 1928'
12:30 13:00 0.50 Wash &Rearn fl1928' t/ 1991'
13:00 14:30 1.50 Circulate&Conditionrnud Displace 277 bbl'sfrorn hole cleanpitsoutand fillw/ fresh water
14:30 20:30 6.00 Drill&Slidefl1991' tl 2213'
20:30 21:00 0.50 Trip2 std'sto retrivepipescreen.
21:00 1:30 4.50 Drill&Slidefl2213' tl 2403'
1:30 2:30 1.00 ChangeoutPason depthtraceron fast linesheave in crown.
2:30 6:00 3.50 Drill&Slidefl2403'tl 2466'

Total 24.00

Report by SteveRecord Date August 15,



DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL NAME CONTRACTOR
T.D. AT REPORT FOOTAGE   CUM. DRLG. HRS.
PRESENT OPERATION M/U Shoe Trac 8-5/8" csg 32# J-55   CUM. DAYS (FROM SPUD) 6

TIME BREAKDOWNS
Drilling Trips Wash & Ream Rig Repair
Run csg& Cmnt Circ Rig service NU BOP
WOC Dir.work BOP MI&RU
BIT SUMMARY

Footage Condition
Bit No. Size Make Type Serial No. Depth In Depth Out Drilled T B G Ft/Hr

1 50 1991 1941 4/1E/1 79.2
2 1991' 2715 724 1/1E/1 27.8

SURVEYS:
MUD PROPERTIES
Mud Wt. Vis WL Fltr Ck /32         pH 10.00 Oil% Water, %
PV YP Gels Alkalinity, ppm Salt #/bbl
Solids %Sand calcium, ppm Chlorides MBT
Mud mixed last 24 hrs.

DRILLING ASSEMBLY
BHA

W.O.B.  RPM PSI GPM AVDP/AVDC

Pump #1: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM
Pump #2: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM Date of B.O.P. Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA

DAILY COSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road & Location (gravel) Mud
Rig Cost Trucking-Mud
Fuel Trucking
Casing (Surface) Super.
Cementing Mud Logging
Bits Geologist
Down hole Rental Pason
Directional Equipment Closed Loop
Sur, Rentals Liv, Qtrs,
Directional W/H equipment
Hot Shot Casing crew
Water Float equipment
Mob/demob Welding & Misc, Inspect
Communication Total Cost

DETAILS:

Rig repair change out 2" stand pipe valve, ( washed out )
Drill & Slide f/ 2466' t/ 2530'
Rig repair work on butterfly valve on suction line to #2 pump ( broken Valve )
Drill & Slide f/ 2530' t/ 2593'
Rig Service
Repair rig #1 pump motor clutch air selonoid and change 2 valves on pumps
Drill & Slide f/ 2593' t/ 2715'
Circulate & Condition well mix slug and pump
Short Wiper trip 25 std's SLM dp.
TIH
Circulate & Condition well mix slug and pump
Trip, LD 8" BHA,
Held safety meeting w/ crew & Rig up csg crew
M/U Shoe trac 

Report by Steve Record Date

Total 24.50

August 16, 2011

5:30 6:30 1.00

0:00 4:30 4.50
4:30 5:30 1.00

22:00 23:00 1.00
23:00 0:00 1.00

19:30 20:30 1.00
20:30 22:00 1.50

13:30 14:00 0.50
14:00 19:30 5.50

10:30 13:00 2.50
13:00 13:30 0.50

7:00 9:30 2.50
9:30 10:30 1.00

Start End Hrs
6:00 7:00 1.00

6 1/2 80
5 1/2 100
2715 2715 0 146.5

12.25" bit 1.00'/ 1 Mtr 28.87'/ 1 8" shock sub 9.73'/ 1 8" nmpc 8.38/ 1 8" ubho 2.69/ 1 8" nmdc 30.74/ 1 8" nmdc 30.48'
2 8" dc 59.37/ 1 6 5/8" x 4 1/2" xo 2.68/ 6 6" dc 185.54/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp 737.84'/ total bha 1098.11'
25 Std's 1584.73 Kelly down 33' = 2715'

0 0 2080 610

2,200 7.5

9.0 42 12 97.5

12.25 RMB CW517GX 171 26 4X18

Hours Size
12.25 RMB CD517G 305770 24.5 3X20

Rotating Nozzle

10.5 5.5 2.5
1.5 2 0.5

PLANTSERVICES

Patara Oil & Gas  Middle Mesa Fed,  31-33-29-25 / API# 43-037-31907 Frontier #4
249 55.5

1.5

Sep. 02, 2011

Sundry Number: 18131 API Well Number: 43037319070000

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ APl# 43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier#4
T.D.ATREPORT FOOTAGE 249 CUM.DRLG.HRS. 55.5
PRESENTOPERATION M/UShoeTrac8-5/8" esg 32# J-55 CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 6

TIMEBREAKDOWNS
Drilling 10.5 Trips 5.5 Wash& Ream RigRepair 2.5
Runcsg& Cmnt 1.5 Circ 2 Rigservice 0.5 NUBOP
WOC Dir.work 1.5 BOP Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY
Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition

BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr
1 12.25 RMB CD517G 305770 50 1991 1941 24.5 3X20 4/1E/1 79.2
2 12.25 RMB CW517GX 171 1991' 2715 724 26 4X18 1/1E/1 27.8

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 9.0 vis 42 WL 12 FltrCk /32 pH 10.00 Oil% Water,% 97.5

PV YP Gels Alkalinity,ppm Salt #lbbl
Solids %Sand calcium,ppm Chlorides 2,200 MBT 7.5
Mudmixed last24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 12.25" bit1.00'l1 Mtr28.8TIl 8"shocksub 9.73'l1 8"nmpc8.38/1 8"ubho2.69/l 8"nmdc30.74/1 8"nmde30.48'
2 8" de 59.37/ 1 6 5/8"x 4 1/2"xo2.68/ 6 6" de 185.54/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp737.84'/ totalbha 1098.11'
25 Std's1584.73 Kellydown 33' = 2715'
W.0.B. O RPM 0 Psi 2080 GPM 610 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 6 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 80
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 100 Dateof B.O.P.Test
SLM: Board 2715 Talley 2715 Correction 0 Hourson BHA 146.5

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road&Location(gravel) Mud
RigCost Trucking-Mud

Fuel Trucking
Casing(Surface) Super.
Cementing Mud Logging

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
Directional Equipment ClosedLoop

Sur,Rentals Liv,Qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment
HotShot Casingcrew
Water Floatequipment
Mob/demob Welding&Misc,Inspect
Communication TotalCost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 7:00 1.00 Rig repairchangeout2" standpipevalve, (washed out)
7:00 9:30 2.50 Drill&Slidefl2466'tl 2530'
9:30 10:30 1.00 Rigrepairworkon butterflyvalveon suctionlineto #2 pump( brokenValve)
10:30 13:00 2.50 Drill&Slidef/2530' tl 2593'
13:00 13:30 0.50 RigService
13:30 14:00 0.50 Repair rig #1 pumpmotor clutchairselonoidand change2 valves on pumps
14:00 19:30 5.50 Drill&Slidefl2593'tl 2715'
19:30 20:30 1.00 Circulate&Conditionwellmixslugand pump
20:30 22:00 1.50 ShortWiper trip25 std's SLMdp.
22:00 23:00 1.00 TIH
23:00 0:00 1.00 Circulate&Conditionwellmixslugand pump
0:00 4:30 4.50 Trip,LD8" BHA,
4:30 5:30 1.00 Held safetymeetingw/ crew&Rig upcsg crew
5:30 6:30 1.00 MlUShoetrac

Total 24.50

Report by SteveRecord Date August 16,

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ APl# 43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier#4
T.D.ATREPORT FOOTAGE 249 CUM.DRLG.HRS. 55.5
PRESENTOPERATION M/UShoeTrac8-5/8" esg 32# J-55 CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 6

TIMEBREAKDOWNS
Drilling 10.5 Trips 5.5 Wash& Ream RigRepair 2.5
Runcsg& Cmnt 1.5 Circ 2 Rigservice 0.5 NUBOP
WOC Dir.work 1.5 BOP Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY
Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition

BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr
1 12.25 RMB CD517G 305770 50 1991 1941 24.5 3X20 4/1E/1 79.2
2 12.25 RMB CW517GX 171 1991' 2715 724 26 4X18 1/1E/1 27.8

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 9.0 vis 42 WL 12 FltrCk /32 pH 10.00 Oil% Water,% 97.5

PV YP Gels Alkalinity,ppm Salt #lbbl
Solids %Sand calcium,ppm Chlorides 2,200 MBT 7.5
Mudmixed last24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 12.25" bit1.00'l1 Mtr28.8TIl 8"shocksub 9.73'l1 8"nmpc8.38/1 8"ubho2.69/l 8"nmdc30.74/1 8"nmde30.48'
2 8" de 59.37/ 1 6 5/8"x 4 1/2"xo2.68/ 6 6" de 185.54/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp737.84'/ totalbha 1098.11'
25 Std's1584.73 Kellydown 33' = 2715'
W.0.B. O RPM 0 Psi 2080 GPM 610 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 6 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 80
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 100 Dateof B.O.P.Test
SLM: Board 2715 Talley 2715 Correction 0 Hourson BHA 146.5

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE

Road&Location(gravel) Mud
RigCost Trucking-Mud

Fuel Trucking

Casing(Surface) Super.

Cementing Mud Logging

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
Directional Equipment ClosedLoop

Sur,Rentals Liv,Qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment

HotShot Casingcrew
Water Floatequipment
Mob/demob Welding&Misc,Inspect
Communication TotalCost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 7:00 1.00 Rig repairchangeout2" standpipevalve, (washed out)
7:00 9:30 2.50 Drill&Slidefl2466'tl 2530'
9:30 10:30 1.00 Rigrepairworkon butterflyvalveon suctionlineto #2 pump( brokenValve)
10:30 13:00 2.50 Drill&Slidef/2530' tl 2593'
13:00 13:30 0.50 RigService
13:30 14:00 0.50 Repair rig #1 pumpmotor clutchairselonoidand change2 valves on pumps
14:00 19:30 5.50 Drill&Slidefl2593'tl 2715'
19:30 20:30 1.00 Circulate&Conditionwellmixslugand pump
20:30 22:00 1.50 ShortWiper trip25 std's SLMdp.
22:00 23:00 1.00 TIH
23:00 0:00 1.00 Circulate&Conditionwellmixslugand pump
0:00 4:30 4.50 Trip,LD8" BHA,
4:30 5:30 1.00 Held safetymeetingw/ crew&Rig upcsg crew
5:30 6:30 1.00 MlUShoetrac

Total 24.50

Report by SteveRecord Date August 16,



DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL NAME CONTRACTOR
T.D. AT REPORT FOOTAGE   CUM. DRLG. HRS.
PRESENT OPERATION Wait on welder had leak in weld in spacer spool between binds and  well head   CUM. DAYS (FROM SPUD) 7

TIME BREAKDOWNS
Drilling Trips Wash & Ream Rig Repair
Run csg& Cmnt Circ Rig service NU BOP
WOC Dir.work Test BOP MI&RU
BIT SUMMARY

Footage Condition
Bit No. Size Make Type Serial No. Depth In Depth Out Drilled T B G Ft/Hr

1 50' 1991' 1941' 4/1E/1 79.2
2 1991' 2715' 724' 1/1E/1 27.8

SURVEYS:
MUD PROPERTIES
Mud Wt. Vis WL Fltr Ck /32         pH 10.00 Oil% Water, %
PV YP Gels Alkalinity, ppm Salt #/bbl
Solids %Sand calcium, ppm Chlorides MBT
Mud mixed last 24 hrs.

DRILLING ASSEMBLY
BHA

W.O.B.  RPM PSI GPM AVDP/AVDC

Pump #1: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM
Pump #2: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM Date of B.O.P. Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA

DAILY COSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road & Location (gravel) Mud
Rig Cost Trucking-Mud Disposl
Fuel Trucking
Casing (Surface) Super.
Cementing Wire line
Bits Geologist
Down hole Rental Pason
Directional Equipment Closed Loop
Sur, Rentals Liv, Qtrs,
Directional W/H equipment
Hot Shot Casing crew
Water Float equipment
Mob/demob Welding & Misc, Inspect
Communication Total Cost

DETAILS:

Run 60 jt's 8 5/8" 32# J-55 ST&C to 2010' float collar 2664', Centralizers f 1st jt middle and every other jt to 133'
Circulate with rig pump, Held safety meeting with crews, R/U cementers
Cement test lines to 2500 psi, pump 20 bbl's water spacer, Start cement lead slurry mix 425 sks of Premium lite cmt
to 11.6 ppg a yield of 2.81 ft3, mix gps 16.15 total slurry of 212 bbl's total mix water 163 bbls' 
Start Tail cement mix 125 sks type ll cement w/ additives to 14.2 ppg a yield of 1.47 ft3, 7.35 gps, total 32.77 bbl's  
mix water total 21 bbls, drop plug and displace w/ 162.3 bbl's fresh water, 44 bbls cement to surface, full returns,
Bump plug to 1055 psi held 5 min and released . 5 bbl's flow back floats held, End job 2:00 pm
Pump rate of cement 6.5 bpm, displace @ 5 bpm 
Wait on cement and transfer 579 bbl's drilling mud to disposal Ream trucking pound 80, Clean mud pits w/ Riley's, 
cut of conductor and 8 5/8" csg 17.85', dress csg cut off and weld on a WG,W2BP, 11" 5M x 8-5/8" CSGHD,
N/U BOP,
R/U Single Jack tester, test upper and lower Kelly valves to 250 low 5 min 3000 Hi 10 min and 
Floor safety valves, Test pipe rams, inside kill line valve, outside check valve, HCR, choke manifold
valves, and supper choke, all test 250 low 5 min and 3000 Hi 10 min,
BLM  Jeff Brown on-site 

Report by Steve Record Date

Total 24.00

August 17, 2011

22:00 6:00 8.00
20:00 22:00 2.00

14:00 20:00 6.00

10:15 11:15 1.00
11:15 14:00 2.75

Start End Hrs
6:00 10:15 4.25

6 1/2
5 1/2 8/17/2011

0

Displace with potassium format to drill out.

7 7/8"" bit 1.00'/ 1 Mtr 28.87'/ 1 8" / 1 8" nmpc 8.38/ 1 8" ubho 2.69/ 1 8" nmdc 30.74/ 1 8" nmdc 30.48'
2 8" dc 59.37/ 1 6 5/8" x 4 1/2" xo 2.68/ 6 6" dc 185.54/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp 737.84'/ total bha 1098.11'
25 Std's 1584.73 Kelly down 33' = 2715'

0 0

2,200 7.5

8.6 40 12 97.5

12.25 RMB CW517GX 171 26 4X18

Hours Size
12.25 RMB CD517G 305770 24.5 3X20

Rotating Nozzle

Frontier spacer spool,

7 1 2

PLANTSERVICES

Patara Oil & Gas  Middle Mesa Fed,  31-33-29-25 / API# 43-037-31907 Frontier #4
0 55.5

6 8

Sep. 02, 2011

Sundry Number: 18131 API Well Number: 43037319070000

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ APl# 43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier#4
T.D.ATREPORT FOOTAGE 0 CUM.DRLG.HRS. 55.5
PRESENTOPERATION Waitonwelderhad leakinweldinspacer spoolbetweenbindsand wellhead CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 7
Frontierspacer spool,
TIMEBREAKDOWNS
Drilling Trips Wash& Ream RigRepair
Runcsg& Cmnt 7 Circ 1 Rigservice NUBOP 2

WOC 6 Dir.work Test BOP 8 Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY
Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition

BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr
1 12.25 RMB CD517G 305770 50' 1991' 1941' 24.5 3X20 4/1E/1 79.2
2 12.25 RMB CW517GX 171 1991' 2715' 724' 26 4X18 1/1E/1 27.8

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.6 vis 40 WL 12 FltrCk /32 pH 10.00 Oil% Water,% 97.5

PV YP Gels Alkalinity,ppm Salt #lbbl
Solids %Sand calcium,ppm Chlorides 2,200 MBT 7.5
Mudmixed last24 hrs. Displacewithpotassiumformatto drillout.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 7 7/8""bit1.00'l1 Mtr28.8TIl 8"/ l 8"nmpc8.38/1 8"ubho2.69/1 8"nmde30.74/1 8"nmde30.48'
2 8" de 59.37/ 1 6 5/8"x 4 1/2"xo2.68/ 6 6" de 185.54/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp737.84'/ totalbha 1098.11'
25 Std's1584.73 Kellydown 33' = 2715'
W.0.B. O RPM 0 Psi GPM AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 6 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM

Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM Dateof B.O.P.Test 8/17/2011
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hourson BHA 0

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road&Location(gravel) Mud
RigCost Trucking-MudDisposl
Fuel Trucking
Casing(Surface) Super.
Cementing Wire line

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
Directional Equipment ClosedLoop

Sur,Rentals Liv,Qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment
HotShot Casingcrew
Water Floatequipment
Mob/demob Welding&Misc,Inspect
Communication TotalCost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 10:15 4.25 Run 60jt's8 5/8" 32#J-55 ST&Cto 2010' float collar2664', Centralizersf 1st jt middleand everyotherjt to 133'
10:15 ll:15 1.00 Circulatewithrigpump,Heldsafetymeetingwithcrews,R/Ucementers
ll:15 14:00 2.75 Cementtest linesto 2500 psi,pump20 bbl'swaterspacer,Startcementleadslurrymix425 sks of Premiumlitecmt

to 11.6 ppga yieldof2.81 ft3,mixgps 16.15 totalslurryof212 bbl'stotalmixwater 163 bb|s'
StartTailcementmix125 sks type Ilcementw/ additivesto 14.2 ppga yieldof1.47 ft3,7.35 gps, total32.77bbl's
mixwater total21 bbls,dropplugand displacew/ 162.3 bbl'sfresh water, 44 bblscementto surface,fullreturns,
Bumpplugto 1055 psiheld5 minand released . 5 bb|'sflowbackfloatsheld,Endjob2:00pm
Pumprate ofcement6.5 bpm,displace@ 5 bpm

14:00 20:00 6.00 Wait on cementand transfer579bbl'sdrillingmudto disposalReam truckingpound80,Cleanmudpitsw/ Riley's,
cutofconductorand 8 5/8"csq 17.85', dress csq cutoffand weld on a WG,W2BP,11" 5Mx 8-5/8"CSGHD,

20:00 22:00 2.00 NIUBOP,
22:00 6:00 8.00 R/USingleJack tester,test upperand lowerKellyvalvesto 250low5 min3000 Hi10 minand

Floorsafetyvalves,Test piperams,insidekilllinevalve,outsidecheckvalve,HCR,chokemanifold
valves, and supperchoke,alltest 250 low5 minand 3000Hi10 min,
BLM JeffBrownon-site

Total 24.00

Report by SteveRecord Date August 17,

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ APl# 43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier#4
T.D.ATREPORT FOOTAGE 0 CUM.DRLG.HRS. 55.5
PRESENTOPERATION Waitonwelderhad leakinweldinspacer spoolbetweenbindsand wellhead CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 7
Frontierspacer spool,
TIMEBREAKDOWNS
Drilling Trips Wash& Ream RigRepair
Runcsg& Cmnt 7 Circ 1 Rigservice NUBOP 2

WOC 6 Dir.work Test BOP 8 Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY
Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition

BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr
1 12.25 RMB CD517G 305770 50' 1991' 1941' 24.5 3X20 4/1E/1 79.2
2 12.25 RMB CW517GX 171 1991' 2715' 724' 26 4X18 1/1E/1 27.8

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.6 vis 40 WL 12 FltrCk /32 pH 10.00 Oil% Water,% 97.5

PV YP Gels Alkalinity,ppm Salt #lbbl
Solids %Sand calcium,ppm Chlorides 2,200 MBT 7.5
Mudmixed last24 hrs. Displacewithpotassiumformatto drillout.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 7 7/8""bit1.00'l1 Mtr28.8TIl 8"/ l 8"nmpc8.38/1 8"ubho2.69/1 8"nmde30.74/1 8"nmde30.48'
2 8" de 59.37/ 1 6 5/8"x 4 1/2"xo2.68/ 6 6" de 185.54/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp737.84'/ totalbha 1098.11'
25 Std's1584.73 Kellydown 33' = 2715'
W.0.B. O RPM 0 Psi GPM AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 6 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM

Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM Dateof B.O.P.Test 8/17/2011
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hourson BHA 0

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE

Road&Location(gravel) Mud
RigCost Trucking-MudDisposl
Fuel Trucking

Casing(Surface) Super.

Cementing Wire line

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
Directional Equipment ClosedLoop

Sur,Rentals Liv,Qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment

HotShot Casingcrew
Water Floatequipment
Mob/demob Welding&Misc,Inspect
Communication TotalCost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 10:15 4.25 Run 60jt's8 5/8" 32#J-55 ST&Cto 2010' float collar2664', Centralizersf 1st jt middleand everyotherjt to 133'
10:15 ll:15 1.00 Circulatewithrigpump,Heldsafetymeetingwithcrews,R/Ucementers
ll:15 14:00 2.75 Cementtest linesto 2500 psi,pump20 bbl'swaterspacer,Startcementleadslurrymix425 sks of Premiumlitecmt

to 11.6 ppga yieldof2.81 ft3,mixgps 16.15 totalslurryof212 bbl'stotalmixwater 163 bb|s'
StartTailcementmix125 sks type Ilcementw/ additivesto 14.2 ppga yieldof1.47 ft3,7.35 gps, total32.77bbl's
mixwater total21 bbls,dropplugand displacew/ 162.3 bbl'sfresh water, 44 bblscementto surface,fullreturns,
Bumpplugto 1055 psiheld5 minand released . 5 bb|'sflowbackfloatsheld,Endjob2:00pm
Pumprate ofcement6.5 bpm,displace@ 5 bpm

14:00 20:00 6.00 Wait on cementand transfer579bbl'sdrillingmudto disposalReam truckingpound80,Cleanmudpitsw/ Riley's,
cutofconductorand 8 5/8"csq 17.85', dress csq cutoffand weld on a WG,W2BP,11" 5Mx 8-5/8"CSGHD,

20:00 22:00 2.00 NIUBOP,
22:00 6:00 8.00 R/USingleJack tester,test upperand lowerKellyvalvesto 250low5 min3000 Hi10 minand

Floorsafetyvalves,Test piperams,insidekilllinevalve,outsidecheckvalve,HCR,chokemanifold
valves, and supperchoke,alltest 250 low5 minand 3000Hi10 min,
BLM JeffBrownon-site

Total 24.00

Report by SteveRecord Date August 17,



DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL NAME CONTRACTOR
T.D. AT REPORT FOOTAGE   CUM. DRLG. HRS.
PRESENT OPERATION Drilling @ 2896'   CUM. DAYS (FROM SPUD) 8

TIME BREAKDOWNS
Drilling Trips Wash & Ream Rig Repair
Other Circ Rig service NU BOP
WOC Dir.work Test BOP MI&RU
BIT SUMMARY

Footage Condition
Bit No. Size Make Type Serial No. Depth In Depth Out Drilled T B G Ft/Hr

1 50' 1991' 1941' 4/1E/1 79.2
2 1991' 2715' 724' 1/1E/1 27.8

SURVEYS:
MUD PROPERTIES
Mud Wt. Vis WL Fltr Ck /32         pH 9.50 Oil% Water, %
PV YP Gels Alkalinity, ppm Salt #/bbl
Solids %Sand calcium, ppm Chlorides MBT
Mud mixed last 24 hrs.

DRILLING ASSEMBLY
BHA

W.O.B.  RPM PSI GPM AVDP/AVDC

Pump #1: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM
Pump #2: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM Date of B.O.P. Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA

DAILY COSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road & Location (gravel) Mud
Rig Cost Trucking-Mud Disposl
Fuel Trucking
Casing (Surface) Super.
Cementing Wire line
Bits Geologist
Down hole Rental Pason
Directional Equipment Closed Loop
Sur, Rentals Liv, Qtrs,
Directional W/H equipment
Hot Shot Casing crew
Water Float equipment
Mob/demob Welding & Misc, Inspect
Communication Total Cost

DETAILS:

Repair Rig Nipple down do to leak in frontier drilling spool blew a hole through the weld while testing
Wait on new spool. Spool arrived and nipple back up 
Finished testing BOP test, tested blind 250 low 5 min & Tested casing to 1500 psi 30 min all tests
Witnessed by BLM Jeff Brown.
Set wear bushing
P/U Dir. Tools and orient tools.
TIH T/ 2644'  displace hole with potassium format mud
Wash & Ream Float collar f 2663' to 2664' ream cement f/ 2664' to 2710' drill shoe, ream to 2715' 
Drill f/ 2715' t/ 2896'

Report by Steve Record Date

Total 24.00

August 18, 2011

0:00 2:00 2.00
2:00 6:00 4.00

20:00 21:30 1.50
21:30 0:00 2.50

19:30 20:00 0.50

18:00 19:30 1.50

Start End Hrs
6:00 18:00 12.00

6 1/2 70
5 1/2 90 8/17/2011

6

7 7/8"" bit 1.00'/ 1 Mtr 28.87'/ 1 6.25" / 1 6.5" nmpc 9.42/ 1 6.5" ubho 2.59/ 1 6.25" nmdc 29.70/ 1 6.25" nmdc 30.43'
6 6" dc 184.83/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp 737.84'/ total bha 1022.00'
29 Std's 1838.49 Kelly down 37' = 2898.20'

0 0 1650 530

.02 900 7.5

8.5 36 10 97.5

12.25 RMB CW517GX 171 26 4X18

Hours Size
12.25 RMB CD517G 305770 24.5 3X20

Rotating Nozzle

4 2.5 2 12
0.5

PLANTSERVICES

Patara Oil & Gas  Middle Mesa Fed,  31-33-29-25 / API# 43-037-31907 Frontier #4
181 59.5

1.5 1.5

Sep. 02, 2011

Sundry Number: 18131 API Well Number: 43037319070000

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ APl# 43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier#4
T.D.ATREPORT FOOTAGE 181 CUM.DRLG.HRS. 59.5
PRESENTOPERATION Drilling@ 2896' CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 8

TIMEBREAKDOWNS
Drilling 4 Trips 2.5 Wash& Ream 2 RigRepair 12

Other Circ Rigservice 0.5 NUBOP
WOC Dir.work 1.5 Test BOP 1.5 Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY
Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition

BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr
1 12.25 RMB CD517G 305770 50' 1991' 1941' 24.5 3X20 4/1E/1 79.2
2 12.25 RMB CW517GX 171 1991' 2715' 724' 26 4X18 1/1E/1 27.8

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.5 vis 36 WL 10 FltrCk /32 pH 9.50 Oil% Water,% 97.5

PV YP Gels Alkalinity,ppm Salt #lbbl
Solids %Sand .02 calcium,ppm Chlorides 900 MBT 7.5
Mudmixed last24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 7 7/8""bit1.00'l1 Mtr28.8TIl 6.25"I l 6.5"nmpc9.42/l 6.5"ubho2.59/l 6.25"nmde29.70/l 6.25"nmde30.43'
6 6" de 184.83/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp737.84'/ totalbha 1022.00'
29 Std's1838.49 Kellydown 3T = 2898.20'
W.0.B. O RPM 0 Psi 1650 GPM 530 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 6 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 70
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 90 Dateof B.O.P.Test 8/17/2011
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hourson BHA 6

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road&Location(gravel) Mud
RigCost Trucking-MudDisposl
Fuel Trucking
Casing(Surface) Super.
Cementing Wire line

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
Directional Equipment ClosedLoop

Sur,Rentals Liv,Qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment
HotShot Casingcrew
Water Floatequipment
Mob/demob Welding&Misc,Inspect
Communication TotalCost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 18:00 12.00 Repair Rig Nippledowndo to leak in frontierdrillingspoolblewa hole throughthe weld while testing

Waiton newspool. Spoolarrivedand nipplebackup
18:00 19:30 1.50 FinishedtestingBOPtest, tested blind250 low5 min&Testedcasingto 1500 psi30 minalltests

Witnessed byBLMJeffBrown.
19:30 20:00 0.50 Set wear bushing
20:00 21:30 1.50 P/UDir.Tools and orienttools.
21:30 0:00 2.50 TIHT/2644' displaceholewithpotassiumformatmud
0:00 2:00 2.00 Wash&ReamFloatcollarf 2663' to 2664' reamcementf/2664' to 2710' drillshoe, reamto 2715'
2:00 6:00 4.00 Drillfl2715' tl 2896'

Total 24.00

Report by SteveRecord Date August 18,

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ APl# 43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier#4
T.D.ATREPORT FOOTAGE 181 CUM.DRLG.HRS. 59.5
PRESENTOPERATION Drilling@ 2896' CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 8

TIMEBREAKDOWNS
Drilling 4 Trips 2.5 Wash& Ream 2 RigRepair 12

Other Circ Rigservice 0.5 NUBOP
WOC Dir.work 1.5 Test BOP 1.5 Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY
Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition

BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr
1 12.25 RMB CD517G 305770 50' 1991' 1941' 24.5 3X20 4/1E/1 79.2
2 12.25 RMB CW517GX 171 1991' 2715' 724' 26 4X18 1/1E/1 27.8

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.5 vis 36 WL 10 FltrCk /32 pH 9.50 Oil% Water,% 97.5

PV YP Gels Alkalinity,ppm Salt #lbbl
Solids %Sand .02 calcium,ppm Chlorides 900 MBT 7.5
Mudmixed last24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 7 7/8""bit1.00'l1 Mtr28.8TIl 6.25"I l 6.5"nmpc9.42/l 6.5"ubho2.59/l 6.25"nmde29.70/l 6.25"nmde30.43'
6 6" de 184.83/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp737.84'/ totalbha 1022.00'
29 Std's1838.49 Kellydown 3T = 2898.20'
W.0.B. O RPM 0 Psi 1650 GPM 530 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 6 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 70
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 90 Dateof B.O.P.Test 8/17/2011
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hourson BHA 6

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE

Road&Location(gravel) Mud
RigCost Trucking-MudDisposl
Fuel Trucking

Casing(Surface) Super.

Cementing Wire line

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
Directional Equipment ClosedLoop

Sur,Rentals Liv,Qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment

HotShot Casingcrew
Water Floatequipment
Mob/demob Welding&Misc,Inspect
Communication TotalCost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 18:00 12.00 Repair Rig Nippledowndo to leak in frontierdrillingspoolblewa hole throughthe weld while testing

Waiton newspool. Spoolarrivedand nipplebackup
18:00 19:30 1.50 FinishedtestingBOPtest, tested blind250 low5 min&Testedcasingto 1500 psi30 minalltests

Witnessed byBLMJeffBrown.
19:30 20:00 0.50 Set wear bushing
20:00 21:30 1.50 P/UDir.Tools and orienttools.
21:30 0:00 2.50 TIHT/2644' displaceholewithpotassiumformatmud
0:00 2:00 2.00 Wash&ReamFloatcollarf 2663' to 2664' reamcementf/2664' to 2710' drillshoe, reamto 2715'
2:00 6:00 4.00 Drillfl2715' tl 2896'

Total 24.00

Report by SteveRecord Date August 18,



DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL NAME CONTRACTOR
T.D. AT REPORT FOOTAGE   CUM. DRLG. HRS.
PRESENT OPERATION Drilling @ 4255'   CUM. DAYS (FROM SPUD) 9

TIME BREAKDOWNS
Drilling Trips Wash & Ream Rig Repair
Other Circ Rig service NU BOP
WOC Dir.work Test BOP MI&RU
BIT SUMMARY

Footage Condition
Bit No. Size Make Type Serial No. Depth In Depth Out Drilled T B G Ft/Hr

1 50' 1991' 1941' 4/1E/1 79.2
2 1991' 2715' 724' 1/1E/1 27.8
3 2715 1540 56.0

SURVEYS:
MUD PROPERTIES
Mud Wt. Vis WL Fltr Ck 2 /32         pH 9.50 Oil% Water, %
PV YP Gels Alkalinity, ppm Salt #/bbl
Solids %Sand Potassium, % Chlorides MBT
Mud mixed last 24 hrs.

DRILLING ASSEMBLY
BHA

W.O.B.  RPM PSI GPM AVDP/AVDC

Pump #1: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM
Pump #2: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM Date of B.O.P. Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA

DAILY COSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road & Location (gravel) Mud
Rig Cost Trucking-Mud Disposl
Fuel Trucking
Casing (Surface) Super.
Cementing Wire line
Bits Geologist
Down hole Rental Pason
Directional Equipment Closed Loop
Sur, Rentals Liv, Qtrs,
Directional W/H equipment
Hot Shot Casing crew
Water Float equipment
Mob/demob Welding & Misc, Inspect
Communication Total Cost

DETAILS:

Drill & Slide f/ 2896' t/ 3591'
Circulate clean hole
Drill & Slide f/ 3591' t/ 3687'
Drill & Slide f/ 3687' t/ 4255'

Report by Steve Record Date

Total 24.00

August 19, 2011

18:00 6:00 12.00

15:00 15:30 0.50
15:30 18:00 2.50

Start End Hrs
6:00 15:00 9.00

6 1/2 70
5 1/2 90 8/17/2011

6

7 7/8"" bit 1.00'/ 1 Mtr 28.87'/ 1 6.25" / 1 6.5" nmpc 9.42/ 1 6.5" ubho 2.59/ 1 6.25" nmdc 29.70/ 1 6.25" nmdc 30.43'
6 6" dc 184.83/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp 737.84'/ total bha 1022.00'
50 Std's 3163.44, 1- Single 31.68'  Kelly down 38' = 4255'

18 35/86=121 2000 530 316/584

10 14 7 1
1.34 .02 3 2,800 2.5

4133' inc 16.20 azm 267.0 tvd 3830.86' n-s -147.90 e-w -1423.58 vs 1430.75

8.6 40 10 98.5

7 7/8" Haliburton FX64D 11525563 27.5 6x16
12.25 RMB CW517GX 171 26 4X18

Hours Size
12.25 RMB CD517G 305770 24.5 3X20

Rotating Nozzle

23.5
0.5

PLANTSERVICES

Patara Oil & Gas  Middle Mesa Fed,  31-33-29-25 / API# 43-037-31907 Frontier #4
1359 78

Sep. 02, 2011

Sundry Number: 18131 API Well Number: 43037319070000

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ APl# 43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier#4
T.D.ATREPORT FOOTAGE l 359 CUM.DRLG.HRS. 78
PRESENTOPERATION Drilling@ 4255' CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 9

TIMEBREAKDOWNS
Drilling 23.5 Trips Wash& Ream RigRepair
Other Circ Rigservice 0.5 NUBOP
WOC Dir.work Test BOP Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY
Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition

BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr
1 12.25 RMB CD517G 305770 50' 1991' 1941' 24.5 3X20 4/1E/1 79.2
2 12.25 RMB CW517GX 171 1991' 2715' 724' 26 4X18 1/1E/1 27.8
3 7 7/8" Haliburton FX64D 11525563 2715 1540 27.5 6xl6 56.0

SURVEYS: 4133' inc16.20 azm26TO tvd3830.86' n-s -147.90 e-w-1423.58 vs 1430.75
MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.6 vis 40 WL 10 FltrCk 2 /32 pH 9.50 oli% water,% 98.5

Pv 10 YP 14 Gels 7 Alkalinity,ppm 1 Salt #lbbl
Solids 1.34 %Sand .02 Potassium,% 3 Chlorides 2,800 MBT 2.5
Mudmixed last24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 7 7/8""bit1.00'l1 Mtr28.8TIl 6.25"I l 6.5"nmpc9.42/l 6.5"ubho2.59/l 6.25"nmde29.70/l 6.25"nmde30.43'
6 6" de 184.83/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp737.84'/ totalbha 1022.00'
50 Std's3163.44, 1- Single31.68' Kellydown 38' = 4255'
W.0.B. 18 RPM 35/86=121 PSI 2000 GPM 530 AVap/AVoc 316/584
Pump #1: Liner 6 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 70
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 90 Dateof B.O.P.Test 8/17/2011
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hourson BHA 6

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road&Location(gravel) Mud
RigCost Trucking-MudDisposl
Fuel Trucking
Casing(Surface) Super.
Cementing Wire line

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
Directional Equipment ClosedLoop

Sur,Rentals Liv,Qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment
HotShot Casingcrew
Water Floatequipment
Mob/demob Welding&Misc,Inspect
Communication TotalCost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 15:00 9.00 Drill&Slidefl 2896' tl 3591'
15:00 15:30 0.50 Circulatecleanhole
15:30 18:00 2.50 Drill&Slidefl359l' tl 368T
18:00 6:00 12.00 Drill&Slidef/368T tl 4255'

Total 24.00

Report by SteveRecord Date August 19,

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ APl# 43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier#4
T.D.ATREPORT FOOTAGE l 359 CUM.DRLG.HRS. 78
PRESENTOPERATION Drilling@ 4255' CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 9

TIMEBREAKDOWNS
Drilling 23.5 Trips Wash& Ream RigRepair
Other Circ Rigservice 0.5 NUBOP
WOC Dir.work Test BOP Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY
Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition

BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr
1 12.25 RMB CD517G 305770 50' 1991' 1941' 24.5 3X20 4/1E/1 79.2
2 12.25 RMB CW517GX 171 1991' 2715' 724' 26 4X18 1/1E/1 27.8
3 7 7/8" Haliburton FX64D 11525563 2715 1540 27.5 6xl6 56.0

SURVEYS: 4133' inc16.20 azm26TO tvd3830.86' n-s -147.90 e-w-1423.58 vs 1430.75
MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.6 vis 40 WL 10 FltrCk 2 /32 pH 9.50 oli% water,% 98.5

Pv 10 YP 14 Gels 7 Alkalinity,ppm 1 Salt #lbbl
Solids 1.34 %Sand .02 Potassium,% 3 Chlorides 2,800 MBT 2.5
Mudmixed last24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 7 7/8""bit1.00'l1 Mtr28.8TIl 6.25"I l 6.5"nmpc9.42/l 6.5"ubho2.59/l 6.25"nmde29.70/l 6.25"nmde30.43'
6 6" de 184.83/ 24 4 1/2" hwdp737.84'/ totalbha 1022.00'
50 Std's3163.44, 1- Single31.68' Kellydown 38' = 4255'
W.0.B. 18 RPM 35/86=121 PSI 2000 GPM 530 AVap/AVoc 316/584
Pump #1: Liner 6 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 70
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 90 Dateof B.O.P.Test 8/17/2011
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hourson BHA 6

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE

Road&Location(gravel) Mud
RigCost Trucking-MudDisposl
Fuel Trucking

Casing(Surface) Super.

Cementing Wire line

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
Directional Equipment ClosedLoop

Sur,Rentals Liv,Qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment

HotShot Casingcrew
Water Floatequipment
Mob/demob Welding&Misc,Inspect
Communication TotalCost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 15:00 9.00 Drill&Slidefl 2896' tl 3591'
15:00 15:30 0.50 Circulatecleanhole
15:30 18:00 2.50 Drill&Slidefl359l' tl 368T
18:00 6:00 12.00 Drill&Slidef/368T tl 4255'

Total 24.00

Report by SteveRecord Date August 19,



DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL NAME CONTRACTOR
T.D. AT REPORT FOOTAGE   CUM. DRLG. HRS.
PRESENT OPERATION   CUM. DAYS (FROM SPUD) 11

TIME BREAKDOWS
Drilling Trips Surveys Rig Repair
PU tools Circ Rig service NU BOP
WOC WOC BOP MI&RU
BIT SUMMARY

Footage Condition
Bit No. Size Make Type Serial No. Depth In Depth Out Drilled T B G Ft/Hr

1 50' 1991' 1941' 4/1e/1 47.0
2 1991' 2715' 724' 1/1e/1 27.0
3 2715' 2470 49.4

SURVEYS:
MUD PROPERTIES
Mud Wt. Vis WL Fltr Ck 2 /32         pH 9.50 Oil% Water, %
PV YP Gels Alkilinity, ppm Salt #/bbl
Solids %Sand calcium, ppm Chlorides Other
Mud mixed last 24 hrs.

DRILLING ASSEMBLY
BHA

W.O.B.  RPM PSI GPM AVDP/AVDC

Pump #1: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM
Pump #2: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM Date of B.O.P. Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA

DAILY COSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road & Location (gravel) Mud
Rig Cost Trucking-Mud disposal
Fuel Trucking
Casing (Surface) Super.
Cementing Wire Line
Bits Geologist
Downhole Rental Pason
Directional Equipment Zeco
Sur,Rentals liv, qtrs,
Directional W/H equipment
Water Casing crew
Mob/demob Float equipment
Communication Weldin & misc, ,inspection

Total Cost

DETAILS:

Report by Date

Total 24.00

Jim hogue August 20, 2011

18:00 6:00 12.00 Drill & Slide F/4730' T/5185'

15:00 16:00 1.00 Circulate Work Pipe Change Liners  No 1 # Pump T/ 5 1/2
16:00 18:00 2.00 Drill F/4622' T/4730'

11:00 11:30 0.50 Rig Service
11:30 15:00 3.50 Drill & Slide F/4580' T/4622'

Start End Hrs
6:00 11:00 5.00 Drill & Slide F/4255' T/4508'

5 1/2 86
5 1/2 85

29.5

7 7/8" bit 1.00' /1mtr, 28.87'/1 16.25" / 1  6.5" nmpc 9.42/ 1 6.5" ubbo 2.59/ 1  6.25" nmdc 29.70/ 1  6.25" nmdc 30.43'
6  6"dc  184.83/ 24  4 1/2 hwdp  737.84' / total bha 1022.00  

1 35 1642 571

10 14 7 0.9
1.5 0 2,800

4988'-inc,-2.50-azm,-232.50 = 5019'-inc,-2.00-azm,-216.10=5050'-inc,-1.80 -azm,-213.00

8.9 40 10 98.5

7-7/8" Haliburton FX64D 11525563 51 6x16
12.25 Rmd Cw517gx 171 26 4x18

Rotating Nozzle
Hours Size

12.25 Rmd cd517g 305770 41 3x20

Drilling @ 5185

23.5

PLANTSERVICES

Patara Oil & Gas Middle Mesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ ap # 43-037-31907 Frontier  4#
5185' 930' 118

0.5

Sep. 02, 2011

Sundry Number: 18131 API Well Number: 43037319070000

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ap #43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier 4#
T.D. AT REPORT 5185' FOOTAGE 930' CUM.DRLG.HRS. 118
PRESENTOPERATION Drilling@ 5185 CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 11

TIMEBREAKDOWS
Drilling 23.5 Trips Surveys RigRepair
PUtools Circ Rigservice 0.5 NUBOP
WOC WOC BOP Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY

Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition
BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr

1 12.25 Rmd cd517g 305770 50' 1991 1941' 41 3x20 4/lell 47.0
2 12.25 Rmd Cw517gx 171 1991' 2715' 724' 26 4x18 1/le/1 27.0
3 7-7/8" Haliburton FX64D 11525563 2715' 2470 51 6x16 49.4

SURVEYS: 4988'-inc,-2.50-azm,-232.50=5019'-inc,-2.00-azm,-216.10=5050'-inc,-1.80-azm,-213.00

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.9 vis 40 WL 10 FltrCk 2 /32 pH 9.50 Oil% Water,% 98.5
Pv 10 YP 14 Geis 7 Alkilinity,ppm 0.9 Salt #/bbl

Solids 1.5 %Sand 0 calcium,ppm Chlorides 2,800 Other
Mudmixedlast24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 7 7/8" bit1.00'll mtr,28.8T/1 16.25" / 1 6.5"nmpc9.42/1 6.5"ubbo2.59/ 1 6.25"nmdc29.70/ 1 6.25"nmde30.43'
6 6"de 184.83/ 24 4 1/2 hwdp 737.84'Itotalbha 1022.00

W.O.B. 1 RPM 35 PSI 1642 GPM 571 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 86
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 85 DateofB.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA 29.5

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road &Location (gravel) Mud

RigCost Trucking-Mud disposal
Fuel Trucking
Casing(Surface) Super.
Cementing Wire Line

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
DirectionalEquipment Zeco
Sur,Rentals liv,qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment
Water Casingcrew
Mob/demob Floatequipment
Communication Weldin&misc,,inspection

Total Cost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 ll:00 5.00 Drill&SlideF/4255'T/4508'
l1:00 11:30 0.50 RigService
11:30 15:00 3.50 Drill&SlideFl4580' T/4622'
15:00 16:00 1.00 CirculateWork Pipe ChangeLiners No 1 # Pump TI5 1/2
16:00 18:00 2.00 DrillF/4622'T/4730'
18:00 6:00 12.00 Drill&SlideF/4730'T/5185'

Total 24.00

Reportby Jimhogue Date August20,

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MiddleMesa Fed, 31-33-29-25/ap #43-037-31907 CONTRACTOR Frontier 4#
T.D. AT REPORT 5185' FOOTAGE 930' CUM.DRLG.HRS. 118
PRESENTOPERATION Drilling@ 5185 CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 11

TIMEBREAKDOWS

Drilling 23.5 Trips Surveys RigRepair
PUtools Circ Rigservice 0.5 NUBOP
WOC WOC BOP Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY

Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition
BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr

1 12.25 Rmd cd517g 305770 50' 1991 1941' 41 3x20 4/lell 47.0
2 12.25 Rmd Cw517gx 171 1991' 2715' 724' 26 4x18 1/le/1 27.0
3 7-7/8" Haliburton FX64D 11525563 2715' 2470 51 6x16 49.4

SURVEYS: 4988'-inc,-2.50-azm,-232.50=5019'-inc,-2.00-azm,-216.10=5050'-inc,-1.80-azm,-213.00

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.9 vis 40 WL 10 FltrCk 2 /32 pH 9.50 Oil% Water,% 98.5
Pv 10 YP 14 Geis 7 Alkilinity,ppm 0.9 Salt #/bbl

Solids 1.5 %Sand 0 calcium,ppm Chlorides 2,800 Other
Mudmixedlast24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 7 7/8" bit1.00'll mtr,28.8T/1 16.25" / 1 6.5"nmpc9.42/1 6.5"ubbo2.59/ 1 6.25"nmdc29.70/ 1 6.25"nmde30.43'
6 6"de 184.83/ 24 4 1/2 hwdp 737.84'Itotalbha 1022.00

W.O.B. 1 RPM 35 PSI 1642 GPM 571 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 86
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 85 DateofB.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA 29.5

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road &Location (gravel) Mud

RigCost Trucking-Mud disposal
Fuel Trucking
Casing(Surface) Super.

Cementing Wire Line

Bits Geologist

DownholeRental Pason
DirectionalEquipment Zeco
Sur,Rentals liv,qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment
Water Casingcrew

Mob/demob Floatequipment
Communication Weldin&misc,,inspection

Total Cost

DETAILS:

Start End Hrs
6:00 ll:00 5.00 Drill&SlideF/4255'T/4508'
l1:00 11:30 0.50 RigService
11:30 15:00 3.50 Drill&SlideFl4580' T/4622'
15:00 16:00 1.00 CirculateWork Pipe ChangeLiners No 1 # Pump TI5 1/2
16:00 18:00 2.00 DrillF/4622'T/4730'
18:00 6:00 12.00 Drill&SlideF/4730'T/5185'

Total 24.00

Reportby Jimhogue Date August20,



DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL NAME CONTRACTOR
T.D. AT REPORT FOOTAGE   CUM. DRLG. HRS.
PRESENT OPERATION   CUM. DAYS (FROM SPUD) 12

TIME BREAKDOWS
Drilling Trips Surveys Rig Repair
PU tools Circ Rig service NU BOP
WOC WOC BOP MI&RU
BIT SUMMARY

Footage Condition
Bit No. Size Make Type Serial No. Depth In Depth Out Drilled T B G Ft/Hr

1 50' 1991' 1941' 47.0
2 1991' 2715' 724' 27.0
3 2715' 3141' 42.7

SURVEYS:
MUD PROPERTIES
Mud Wt. Vis WL Fltr Ck 2 /32         pH 9.00 Oil% Water, %
PV YP Gels Alkilinity, ppm Salt #/bbl
Solids %Sand calcium, ppm Chlorides Other
Mud mixed last 24 hrs.

DRILLING ASSEMBLY
BHA

W.O.B.  RPM PSI GPM AVDP/AVDC

Pump #1: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM
Pump #2: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM Date of B.O.P. Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA

DAILY COSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road & Location (gravel) Mud
Rig Cost Trucking-Mud disposal
Fuel Trucking
Casing (Surface) Super.
Cementing wire line
Bits Geologist
Downhole Rental Pason
Directional Equipment zeco
sur, rentals liv, qtrs,
Directional W/H equipment
Water Casing crew
Mob/demob Float equipment
Communication welding & misc, insp,

Total Cost

DETAILS:

Report by Date

Total 24.00

Jim Hogue August 21, 2011

Working Pipe & Reaming Dog Legs & Tight Spots @ Connections When Needed

18:00 6:00 12.00 Drlg, & Slide F/5520 T/5868'

8:30 10:00 1.50 Circulate & Cond, Rig Service
10;00 18:00 8.00 Drlg, & Slide F/5270 T/5520

Start End Hrs
6:00 8:30 2.50 Drig, & Slide F/5185 T/5270

5 1/2 85
5 1/2 85

52

7 7/8" bit 1.00 / 1,mtr,28.87' /1-16.25 /1 6.5"nmpc, 9.42 / 1 6.5"ubbo, 2.59 / 1 6.25"nmdc 29.70 / 1 6.25"nmdc 30.43'
6 - 6" dc,-184.83 / 24 - 4 1/2 hwdp 737.84' total, bha, = 1022.00

25 35 1800 576

10 16 11 0.8
3 .05 3,500

5651'-inc,-3.30 -azm,-220.30 =5683'-inc,-3.60 -azm, -209.00 = 5714' -inc,-3.70-azm,-202.10

8.9 41 8 97

7/7/2008 Haliburton Fx64d 11525563 73.5 6x16
12.25 rmd Cw517gx 171 26 4x18

Rotating Nozzle
Hours Size

12.25 rmd Cd517g 305770 41 3x20

Drilling & Sliding @ 5856'
Formation Honaker 1#

22.5

PLANTSERVICES

Patara Oil & Gas   MMF, 31-33 29-25  Frontier 4#
5856' 671' 140.5

1.5

Sep. 02, 2011

Sundry Number: 18131 API Well Number: 43037319070000

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MMF,31-3329-25 CONTRACTOR Frontier4#
T.D. AT REPORT 5856' FOOTAGE 671' CUM.DRLG.HRS. 140.5
PRESENTOPERATION Drilling&Sliding@ 5856' CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 12
FormationHonakerl#
TIMEBREAKDOWS
Drilling 22.5 Trips Surveys RigRepair
PUtools Circ 1.5 Rigservice NUBOP
WOC WOC BOP Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY

Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition
BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr

1 12.25 rmd Cd517g 305770 50' 1991' 1941' 41 3x20 47.0
2 12.25 rmd Cw517gx 171 1991' 2715' 724' 26 4x18 27.0
3 7/7/2008 Haliburton Fx64d 11525563 2715' 3141' 73.5 6x16 42.7

SURVEYS: 5651'-inc,-3.30 -azm,-220.30=5683'-inc,-3.60 -azm,-209.00 = 5714' -inc,-3.70-azm,-202.10
MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.9 vis 41 WL 8 FltrCk 2 /32 pH 9.00 Oil% Water,% 9/
Pv 10 YP 16 Gels 11 Alkilinity,ppm 0.8 Salt #/bbl

Solids 3 %Sand .05 calcium,ppm Chlorides 3,500 Other
Mudmixedlast24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 7 7/8" bit1.00 l l,mtr,28.8T /1-16.25Il 6.5"nmpc,9.42/ 1 6.5"ubbo,2.59 ll 6.25"nmdc29.70 ll 6.25"nmdc30.43'
6 - 6"de,-184.83/ 24 - 4 1/2 hwdp737.84' total,bha, = 1022.00

W.O.B. 25 RPM 35 PSI 1800 GPM 576 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 85
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 85 DateofB.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA 52

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road &Location (gravel) Mud

RigCost Trucking-Mud disposal
Fuel Trucking
Casing(Surface) Super.
Cementing wire line

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
DirectionalEquipment zeco

sur, rentals liv,qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment
Water Casingcrew
Mob/demob Floatequipment
Communication welding &misc, insp,

Total Cost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 8:30 2.50 Drig,&SlideFl5185Tl5270
8:30 10:00 1.50 Circulate&Cond,RigService
10;00 18:00 8.00 Drlg,&SlideFl5270 T/5520
18:00 6:00 12.00 Drlg,&SlideFl5520 T/5868'

WorkingPipe&ReamingDogLegs&TightSpots@ ConnectionsWhenNeeded

Total 24.00

Reportby JimHogue Date August21,

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MMF,31-3329-25 CONTRACTOR Frontier4#
T.D. AT REPORT 5856' FOOTAGE 671' CUM.DRLG.HRS. 140.5
PRESENTOPERATION Drilling&Sliding@ 5856' CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 12
FormationHonakerl#
TIMEBREAKDOWS

Drilling 22.5 Trips Surveys RigRepair
PUtools Circ 1.5 Rigservice NUBOP
WOC WOC BOP Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY

Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition
BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr

1 12.25 rmd Cd517g 305770 50' 1991' 1941' 41 3x20 47.0
2 12.25 rmd Cw517gx 171 1991' 2715' 724' 26 4x18 27.0
3 7/7/2008 Haliburton Fx64d 11525563 2715' 3141' 73.5 6x16 42.7

SURVEYS: 5651'-inc,-3.30 -azm,-220.30=5683'-inc,-3.60 -azm,-209.00 = 5714' -inc,-3.70-azm,-202.10
MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.9 vis 41 WL 8 FltrCk 2 /32 pH 9.00 Oil% Water,% 9/
Pv 10 YP 16 Gels 11 Alkilinity,ppm 0.8 Salt #/bbl

Solids 3 %Sand .05 calcium,ppm Chlorides 3,500 Other
Mudmixedlast24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 7 7/8" bit1.00 l l,mtr,28.8T /1-16.25Il 6.5"nmpc,9.42/ 1 6.5"ubbo,2.59 ll 6.25"nmdc29.70 ll 6.25"nmdc30.43'
6 - 6"de,-184.83/ 24 - 4 1/2 hwdp737.84' total,bha, = 1022.00

W.O.B. 25 RPM 35 PSI 1800 GPM 576 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 85
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 85 DateofB.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA 52

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road &Location (gravel) Mud

RigCost Trucking-Mud disposal
Fuel Trucking
Casing(Surface) Super.

Cementing wire line

Bits Geologist

DownholeRental Pason
DirectionalEquipment zeco

sur, rentals liv,qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment
Water Casingcrew

Mob/demob Floatequipment
Communication welding &misc, insp,

Total Cost

DETAILS:

Start End Hrs
6:00 8:30 2.50 Drig,&SlideFl5185Tl5270
8:30 10:00 1.50 Circulate&Cond,RigService
10;00 18:00 8.00 Drlg,&SlideFl5270 T/5520
18:00 6:00 12.00 Drlg,&SlideFl5520 T/5868'

WorkingPipe&ReamingDogLegs&TightSpots@ ConnectionsWhenNeeded

Total 24.00

Reportby JimHogue Date August21,



DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL NAME CONTRACTOR
T.D. AT REPORT FOOTAGE   CUM. DRLG. HRS.
PRESENT OPERATION   CUM. DAYS (FROM SPUD) 13

TIME BREAKDOWS
Drilling Trips Surveys Rig Repair
wireline logs Circ Rig service NU BOP
WOC WOC BOP MI&RU
BIT SUMMARY

Footage Condition
Bit No. Size Make Type Serial No. Depth In Depth Out Drilled T B G Ft/Hr

1 50' 1991' 1941' 47.0
2 1991' 2715' 724' 27.0
3 2715' 6247' 3532' 43.1

SURVEYS:
MUD PROPERTIES
Mud Wt. Vis WL Fltr Ck 2 /32         pH 9.00 Oil% Water, %
PV YP Gels Alkilinity, ppm Salt #/bbl
Solids %Sand calcium, ppm Chlorides Other
Mud mixed last 24 hrs.

DRILLING ASSEMBLY
BHA

W.O.B.  RPM PSI GPM AVDP/AVDC

Pump #1: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM
Pump #2: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM Date of B.O.P. Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA

DAILY COSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road & Location (gravel) Mud
Rig Cost Trucking-Mud disposal
Fuel Trucking
Casing (Surface) Super.
Cementing wire line
Bits Geologist
Downhole Rental Pason
Directional Equipment zeco
sur, rentals liv, qtrs,
Directional W/H equipment
Water Casing crew
Mob/demob Float equipment
Communication welding & misc, insp,

Total Cost

DETAILS:

Report by Date

Total 23.00

Jim Hogue August 22, 2011

2:00 6:00 4.00 rigup weatherford wireline & run loggs

18:00 19:00 1.00 td, 6247' Circulate & Pump pill
19:00 2:00 6.00 Trip Out of hole for logs, straping out lay down m, motor & dirc, tools

14:30 15:30 1.00 Pump Sweep & Circulate
15:30 18:00 2.50 Short Trip  25 Stands  @ 4680'

Start End Hrs
6:00 14:30 8.50 Drlg & slide F/5856' T/6247' Stop 33' Short Mud Motor Failure

5 1/2 85
5 1/2 85

60.5

7 7/8" bit 1.00 / 1,mtr,28.87' /1-16.25 /1 6.5"nmpc, 9.42 / 1 6.5"ubbo, 2.59 / 1 6.25"nmdc 29.70 / 1 6.25"nmdc 30.43'
6 - 6" dc,-184.83 / 24 - 4 1/2 hwdp 737.84' total, bha, = 1022.00

25 35 1800 576

11 17 11 0.8
4 .03 3,300

9.1 42 8 96

7/7/2008 Haliburton Fx64d 11525563 82 6x16
12.25 rmd Cw517gx 171 26 4x18

Rotating Nozzle
Hours Size

12.25 rmd Cd517g 305770 41 3x20

weatherford wireline rigup run loggs,
loggs went to bottom okay

8.5 9.5

PLANTSERVICES

Patara Oil & Gas   MMF, 31-33 29-25  Frontier 4#
6247' 391' 149

4 2

Sep. 02, 2011

Sundry Number: 18131 API Well Number: 43037319070000

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MMF,31-3329-25 CONTRACTOR Frontier4#
T.D. AT REPORT 624T FOOTAGE 391' CUM.DRLG.HRS. 149
PRESENTOPERATION weatherfordwirelineriguprun loggS, CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 13
loggswentto bottomokay
TIMEBREAKDOWS
Drilling 8.5 Trips 9.5 Surveys RigRepair
wireline logs 4 Circ 2 Rigservice NUBOP
WOC WOC BOP Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY

Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition
BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr

1 12.25 rmd Cd517g 305770 50' 1991' 1941' 41 3x20 47.0
2 12.25 rmd Cw517gx 171 1991' 2715' 724' 26 4x18 27.0
3 7/7/2008 Haliburton Fx64d 11525563 2715' 624T 3532' 82 6x16 43.1

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 9.1 vis 42 WL 8 FltrCk 2 /32 pH 9.00 Oil% Water,% 96
PV 11 YP 17 Gels 11 Alkilinity,ppm 0.8 Salt #/bbl

Solids 4 %Sand .03 calcium,ppm Chlorides 3,300 Other
Mudmixedlast24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 7 7/8" bit1.00 l l,mtr,28.8T /1-16.25Il 6.5"nmpc,9.42/ 1 6.5"ubbo,2.59 ll 6.25"nmdc29.70 ll 6.25"nmdc30.43'
6 - 6"de,-184.83/ 24 - 4 1/2 hwdp737.84' total,bha, = 1022.00

W.O.B. 25 RPM 35 PSI 1800 GPM 576 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 85
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 85 DateofB.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA 60.5

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road &Location (gravel) Mud

RigCost Trucking-Mud disposal
Fuel Trucking
Casing(Surface) Super.
Cementing wire line

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
DirectionalEquipment zeco

sur, rentals liv,qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment
Water Casingcrew
Mob/demob Floatequipment
Communication welding &misc, insp,

Total Cost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 14:30 8.50 Drlg&slideF/5856'Tl624TStop33' ShortMudMotorFailure
14:30 15:30 1.00 Pump Sweep&Circulate
15:30 18:00 2.50 ShortTrip 25 Stands @ 4680'
18:00 19:00 1.00 td, 624T Circulate&Pump pill
19:00 2:00 6.00 TripOutofholeforlogs,strapingout laydownm,motor&dirc,tools
2:00 6:00 4.00 rigupweatherfordwireline&runloggs

Total 23.00

Reportby JimHogue Date August22,

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MMF,31-3329-25 CONTRACTOR Frontier4#
T.D. AT REPORT 624T FOOTAGE 391' CUM.DRLG.HRS. 149
PRESENTOPERATION weatherfordwirelineriguprun loggS, CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 13
loggswentto bottomokay
TIMEBREAKDOWS

Drilling 8.5 Trips 9.5 Surveys RigRepair
wireline logs 4 Circ 2 Rigservice NUBOP
WOC WOC BOP Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY

Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition
BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr

1 12.25 rmd Cd517g 305770 50' 1991' 1941' 41 3x20 47.0
2 12.25 rmd Cw517gx 171 1991' 2715' 724' 26 4x18 27.0
3 7/7/2008 Haliburton Fx64d 11525563 2715' 624T 3532' 82 6x16 43.1

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 9.1 vis 42 WL 8 FltrCk 2 /32 pH 9.00 Oil% Water,% 96
PV 11 YP 17 Gels 11 Alkilinity,ppm 0.8 Salt #/bbl

Solids 4 %Sand .03 calcium,ppm Chlorides 3,300 Other
Mudmixedlast24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 7 7/8" bit1.00 l l,mtr,28.8T /1-16.25Il 6.5"nmpc,9.42/ 1 6.5"ubbo,2.59 ll 6.25"nmdc29.70 ll 6.25"nmdc30.43'
6 - 6"de,-184.83/ 24 - 4 1/2 hwdp737.84' total,bha, = 1022.00

W.O.B. 25 RPM 35 PSI 1800 GPM 576 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 85
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 85 DateofB.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA 60.5

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road &Location (gravel) Mud

RigCost Trucking-Mud disposal
Fuel Trucking
Casing(Surface) Super.

Cementing wire line

Bits Geologist

DownholeRental Pason
DirectionalEquipment zeco

sur, rentals liv,qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment
Water Casingcrew

Mob/demob Floatequipment
Communication welding &misc, insp,

Total Cost

DETAILS:

Start End Hrs
6:00 14:30 8.50 Drlg&slideF/5856'Tl624TStop33' ShortMudMotorFailure
14:30 15:30 1.00 Pump Sweep&Circulate
15:30 18:00 2.50 ShortTrip 25 Stands @ 4680'
18:00 19:00 1.00 td, 624T Circulate&Pump pill
19:00 2:00 6.00 TripOutofholeforlogs,strapingout laydownm,motor&dirc,tools
2:00 6:00 4.00 rigupweatherfordwireline&runloggs

Total 23.00

Reportby JimHogue Date August22,



DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL NAME CONTRACTOR
T.D. AT REPORT FOOTAGE   CUM. DRLG. HRS.
PRESENT OPERATION   CUM. DAYS (FROM SPUD) 14

TIME BREAKDOWS
Drilling Trips Surveys Rig Repair
wireline logs Circ Rig service NU BOP
WOC WOC BOP MI&RU
BIT SUMMARY

Footage Condition
Bit No. Size Make Type Serial No. Depth In Depth Out Drilled T B G Ft/Hr

1 50' 1991' 1941' 47.0
2 1991' 2715' 724' 27.0
3 2715' 6247' 3532' 43.1

SURVEYS:
MUD PROPERTIES
Mud Wt. Vis WL Fltr Ck 2 /32         pH 9.00 Oil% Water, %
PV YP Gels Alkilinity, ppm Salt #/bbl
Solids %Sand calcium, ppm Chlorides Other
Mud mixed last 24 hrs.

DRILLING ASSEMBLY
BHA

W.O.B.  RPM PSI GPM AVDP/AVDC

Pump #1: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM
Pump #2: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM Date of B.O.P. Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA

DAILY COSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road & Location (gravel) Mud
Rig Cost Trucking-Mud disposal
Fuel Trucking
Casing (Surface) Super.
Cementing wire line
Bits Geologist
Downhole Rental Pason
Directional Equipment zeco
sur, rentals liv, qtrs,
Directional W/H equipment
Water Casing crew
Mob/demob Float equipment
Communication welding & misc, insp,

Total Cost

DETAILS:

Report by Date

Total 24.00

Jim Hogue August 23, 2011

2:30 4:00 1.50 Circulate & Rig Up Lay Down Machine
4:00 6:00 2.00 Laying Down Drill Pipe

18:00 20:30 2.50 Finish Running Loggs, & Rig Down Weatherford
20:30 2:30 6.00 Trip In Hole w/ Bit Kelly UP Circ & Condition Hole T/ Run Pipe

Start End Hrs
6:00 18:00 12.00 Weatherford Run Wireline Loggs Tag @ 6243' Wireline measurement

5 1/2 85
5 1/2 85

60.5

7 7/8" bit 1.00 / 1,mtr,28.87' /1-16.25 /1 6.5"nmpc, 9.42 / 1 6.5"ubbo, 2.59 / 1 6.25"nmdc 29.70 / 1 6.25"nmdc 30.43'
6 - 6" dc,-184.83 / 24 - 4 1/2 hwdp 737.84' total, bha, = 1022.00

25 35 1800 576

11 13 9 0.8
3 .02 3,000

8.9 40 8 97

7/7/2008 Haliburton Fx64d 11525563 82 6x16
12.25 rmd Cw517gx 171 26 4x18

Rotating Nozzle
Hours Size

12.25 rmd Cd517g 305770 41 3x20

Laying Down Drill Pipe
 

8

PLANTSERVICES

Patara Oil & Gas   MMF, 31-33 29-25  Frontier 4#
6247'  149

14.5 1.5

Sep. 02, 2011

Sundry Number: 18131 API Well Number: 43037319070000

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MMF,31-3329-25 CONTRACTOR Frontier4#
T.D. AT REPORT 624T FOOTAGE CUM.DRLG.HRS. 149
PRESENTOPERATION LayingDownDrillPipe CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 14

TIMEBREAKDOWS
Drilling Trips 8 Surveys RigRepair
wireline logs 14.5 circ 1.5 Rigservice NUBOP
WOC WOC BOP Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY

Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition
BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr

1 12.25 rmd Cd517g 305770 50' 1991' 1941' 41 3x20 47.0
2 12.25 rmd Cw517gx 171 1991' 2715' 724' 26 4x18 27.0
3 7/7/2008 Haliburton Fx64d 11525563 2715' 624T 3532' 82 6x16 43.1

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.9 vis 40 WL 8 FltrCk 2 /32 pH 9.00 Oil% Water,% 9/
PV 11 YP 13 Gels 9 Alkilinity,ppm 0.8 Salt #/bbl

Solids 3 %Sand .02 calcium,ppm Chlorides 3,000 Other
Mudmixedlast24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 7 7/8" bit1.00 l l,mtr,28.8T /1-16.25Il 6.5"nmpc,9.42/ 1 6.5"ubbo,2.59 ll 6.25"nmdc29.70 ll 6.25"nmdc30.43'
6 - 6"de,-184.83/ 24 - 4 1/2 hwdp737.84' total,bha, = 1022.00

W.O.B. 25 RPM 35 PSI 1800 GPM 576 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 85
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 85 DateofB.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA 60.5

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road &Location (gravel) Mud

RigCost Trucking-Mud disposal
Fuel Trucking
Casing(Surface) Super.
Cementing wire line

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
DirectionalEquipment zeco

sur, rentals liv,qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment
Water Casingcrew
Mob/demob Floatequipment
Communication welding &misc, insp,

Total Cost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 18:00 12.00 WeatherfordRunWirelineLoggsTag @ 6243' Wirelinemeasurement
18:00 20:30 2.50 Finish Running Loggs, & Rig DownWeatherford
20:30 2:30 6.00 Trip In Holewl BitKellyUP Circ&ConditionHoleTIRun Pipe
2:30 4:00 1.50 Circulate& Rig UpLay DownMachine
4:00 6:00 2.00 LayingDownDrillPipe

Total 24.00

Reportby JimHogue Date August23,

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MMF,31-3329-25 CONTRACTOR Frontier4#
T.D. AT REPORT 624T FOOTAGE CUM.DRLG.HRS. 149
PRESENTOPERATION LayingDownDrillPipe CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 14

TIMEBREAKDOWS

Drilling Trips 8 Surveys RigRepair
wireline logs 14.5 circ 1.5 Rigservice NUBOP
WOC WOC BOP Ml&RU

BITSUMMARY

Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition
BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr

1 12.25 rmd Cd517g 305770 50' 1991' 1941' 41 3x20 47.0
2 12.25 rmd Cw517gx 171 1991' 2715' 724' 26 4x18 27.0
3 7/7/2008 Haliburton Fx64d 11525563 2715' 624T 3532' 82 6x16 43.1

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.9 vis 40 WL 8 FltrCk 2 /32 pH 9.00 Oil% Water,% 9/
PV 11 YP 13 Gels 9 Alkilinity,ppm 0.8 Salt #/bbl

Solids 3 %Sand .02 calcium,ppm Chlorides 3,000 Other
Mudmixedlast24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 7 7/8" bit1.00 l l,mtr,28.8T /1-16.25Il 6.5"nmpc,9.42/ 1 6.5"ubbo,2.59 ll 6.25"nmdc29.70 ll 6.25"nmdc30.43'
6 - 6"de,-184.83/ 24 - 4 1/2 hwdp737.84' total,bha, = 1022.00

W.O.B. 25 RPM 35 PSI 1800 GPM 576 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 85
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 85 DateofB.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA 60.5

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road &Location (gravel) Mud

RigCost Trucking-Mud disposal
Fuel Trucking
Casing(Surface) Super.

Cementing wire line

Bits Geologist

DownholeRental Pason
DirectionalEquipment zeco

sur, rentals liv,qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment
Water Casingcrew

Mob/demob Floatequipment
Communication welding &misc, insp,

Total Cost

DETAILS:

Start End Hrs
6:00 18:00 12.00 WeatherfordRunWirelineLoggsTag @ 6243' Wirelinemeasurement
18:00 20:30 2.50 Finish Running Loggs, & Rig DownWeatherford
20:30 2:30 6.00 Trip In Holewl BitKellyUP Circ&ConditionHoleTIRun Pipe
2:30 4:00 1.50 Circulate& Rig UpLay DownMachine
4:00 6:00 2.00 LayingDownDrillPipe

Total 24.00

Reportby JimHogue Date August23,



DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL NAME CONTRACTOR
T.D. AT REPORT FOOTAGE   CUM. DRLG. HRS.
PRESENT OPERATION   CUM. DAYS (FROM SPUD) 15

TIME BREAKDOWS
Drilling Trips Surveys Rig Repair
run csg Circ Rig service NU BOP
WOC WOC BOP MI&RU
BIT SUMMARY

Footage Condition
Bit No. Size Make Type Serial No. Depth In Depth Out Drilled T B G Ft/Hr

1 50' 1991' 1941' 47.0
2 1991' 2715' 724' 27.0
3 2715' 6247' 3532' 43.1

SURVEYS:
MUD PROPERTIES
Mud Wt. Vis WL Fltr Ck 2 /32         pH 9.00 Oil% Water, %
PV YP Gels Alkilinity, ppm Salt #/bbl
Solids %Sand calcium, ppm Chlorides Other
Mud mixed last 24 hrs.

DRILLING ASSEMBLY
BHA

W.O.B.  RPM PSI GPM AVDP/AVDC

Pump #1: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM
Pump #2: Liner Stroke Length 10 SPM Date of B.O.P. Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA

DAILY COSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road & Location (gravel) Mud
Rig Cost Trucking-Mud disposal
Fuel Trucking
Casing (Surface) Super.
Cementing wire line
Bits Geologist
Downhole Rental Pason
Directional Equipment zeco
sur, rentals liv, qtrs,
Directional W/H equipment
Water Casing crew
Mob/demob Float equipment
Communication welding & misc, insp,

Total Cost

DETAILS:

Report by Date

PLANTSERVICES

Patara Oil & Gas   MMF, 31-33 29-25  Frontier 4#
6247'  149

10.5 1 6.5
2.5

Release Rig 6:00 Am, 8-24-11
Bump Plug @ 20:40 Pm  Set Casing Slips

3.5

12.25 rmd Cw517gx 171 26 4x18

Rotating Nozzle
Hours Size

12.25 rmd Cd517g 305770 41 3x20

8.9 40 8 97

7/7/2008 Haliburton Fx64d 11525563 82 6x16

11 13 9 0.8
3 .02 3,000

7 7/8" bit 1.00 / 1,mtr,28.87' /1-16.25 /1 6.5"nmpc, 9.42 / 1 6.5"ubbo, 2.59 / 1 6.25"nmdc 29.70 / 1 6.25"nmdc 30.43'
6 - 6" dc,-184.83 / 24 - 4 1/2 hwdp 737.84' total, bha, = 1022.00

25 35 1800 576
5 1/2 85
5 1/2 85

60.5

Start End Hrs
6:00 9:30 3.50 Lay Down Drill Pipe & dcs, pull wear ring

16:00 18:00 2.00 rig down casing equipment
18:00 21:00 3.00 cement /safety meeting press test t/ 4200#  pump 10 bbls h20 spacer / 20bbls mud cleaner 10 bblss, h20 spacer

9:30 11:00 1.50 rig up american boring & casing hold safety meeting
11:00 16:00 5.00 run 151 joints of casing shoe @ 6232' float collar @ 6191'

back rig down cementers
21:00 3:00 6.50 nipple down bop set slips w/76000 # tension cut casing instaall tubing head & test,

496 sxs, cement/slurry wgt, 12.5 yield 2.15 11.36 water 6 gpm, 134.43 bbls, mix water f/total 326.53 bbls,
slurry pumped droped plug displacement 96.1 bbls treated water bumped plug @ 1600 psi held 5 min 1 bbl bleed

release rig 6:00 this am, 

3:00 6:00 3.00 start rigging down get ready f/ trucks

Total 24.50

Jim Hogue August 24, 2011

Sep. 02, 2011

Sundry Number: 18131 API Well Number: 43037319070000

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MMF,31-3329-25 CONTRACTOR Frontier4#
T.D. AT REPORT 624T FOOTAGE CUM.DRLG.HRS. 149
PRESENTOPERATION ReleaseRig6:00Am,8-24-1l CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 15
BumpPlug@ 20:40 Pm Set CasingSlips
TIMEBREAKDOWS
Drilling Trips 3.5 Surveys RigRepair
runesg 10.5 circ l Rigservice NUBOP 6.5

WOC WOC BOP Ml&RU 2.5

BITSUMMARY

Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition
BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr

1 12.25 rmd Cd517g 305770 50' 1991' 1941' 41 3x20 47.0
2 12.25 rmd Cw517gx 171 1991' 2715' 724' 26 4x18 27.0
3 7/7/2008 Haliburton Fx64d 11525563 2715' 624T 3532' 82 6x16 43.1

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.9 vis 40 WL 8 FltrCk 2 /32 pH 9.00 Oil% Water,% 9/
PV 11 YP 13 Gels 9 Alkilinity,ppm 0.8 Salt #/bbl

Solids 3 %Sand .02 calcium,ppm Chlorides 3,000 Other
Mudmixedlast24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 7 7/8" bit1.00 l l,mtr,28.8T /1-16.25Il 6.5"nmpc,9.42/ 1 6.5"ubbo,2.59 ll 6.25"nmdc29.70 ll 6.25"nmdc30.43'
6 - 6"de,-184.83/ 24 - 4 1/2 hwdp737.84' total,bha, = 1022.00

W.O.B. 25 RPM 35 PSI 1800 GPM 576 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 85
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 85 DateofB.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA 60.5

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road &Location (gravel) Mud

RigCost Trucking-Mud disposal
Fuel Trucking
Casing(Surface) Super.
Cementing wire line

Bits Geologist
DownholeRental Pason
DirectionalEquipment zeco

sur, rentals liv,qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment
Water Casingcrew
Mob/demob Floatequipment
Communication welding &misc, insp,

Total Cost

DETAILS:
Start End Hrs
6:00 9:30 3.50 LayDownDrillPipe&dcs, pullwearring
9:30 11:00 1.50 rigup americanboring&casinghold safetymeeting
11:00 16:00 5.00 run151jointsofcasingshoe @ 6232'floatcollar@ 6191'
16:00 18:00 2.00 rig downcasingequipment
18:00 21:00 3.00 cementIsafetymeetingpress test tl4200# pump10 bblsh20spacer/ 20bb\smudcleaner10 bb\ss,h20spacer

496 sxs, cement/slurrywgt,12.5 yield2.15 11.36 water6 gpm,134.43 bbls,mixwaterf/total326.53 bbls,
slurrypumpeddropedplugdisplacement96.1bb|streatedwater bumpedplug@ 1600 psiheld 5 min1 bblbleed
backrigdowncementers

21:00 3:00 6.50 nippledownbopset slipsw/76000#tension cutcasinginstaall tubinghead &test,
3:00 6:00 3.00 start riggingdownget readyfltrucks

release riq6:00thisam,

Total 24.50

Reportby JimHogue Date August24,

PLANTSERVICES
DAILYDRILLINGREPORT

WELLNAME Patara Oil&Gas MMF,31-3329-25 CONTRACTOR Frontier4#
T.D. AT REPORT 624T FOOTAGE CUM.DRLG.HRS. 149
PRESENTOPERATION ReleaseRig6:00Am,8-24-1l CUM.DAYS(FROMSPUD) 15
BumpPlug@ 20:40 Pm Set CasingSlips
TIMEBREAKDOWS

Drilling Trips 3.5 Surveys RigRepair
runesg 10.5 circ l Rigservice NUBOP 6.5

WOC WOC BOP Ml&RU 2.5

BITSUMMARY

Footage Rotating Nozzle Condition
BitNo. Size Make Type SerialNo. DepthIn DepthOut Drilled Hours Size TBG Ft/Hr

1 12.25 rmd Cd517g 305770 50' 1991' 1941' 41 3x20 47.0
2 12.25 rmd Cw517gx 171 1991' 2715' 724' 26 4x18 27.0
3 7/7/2008 Haliburton Fx64d 11525563 2715' 624T 3532' 82 6x16 43.1

SURVEYS:

MUDPROPERTIES
MudWt. 8.9 vis 40 WL 8 FltrCk 2 /32 pH 9.00 Oil% Water,% 9/
PV 11 YP 13 Gels 9 Alkilinity,ppm 0.8 Salt #/bbl

Solids 3 %Sand .02 calcium,ppm Chlorides 3,000 Other
Mudmixedlast24 hrs.

DRILLINGASSEMBLY

BHA 7 7/8" bit1.00 l l,mtr,28.8T /1-16.25Il 6.5"nmpc,9.42/ 1 6.5"ubbo,2.59 ll 6.25"nmdc29.70 ll 6.25"nmdc30.43'
6 - 6"de,-184.83/ 24 - 4 1/2 hwdp737.84' total,bha, = 1022.00

W.O.B. 25 RPM 35 PSI 1800 GPM 576 AVap/AVoc

Pump #1: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 85
Pump#2: Liner 5 1/2 StrokeLength 10 SPM 85 DateofB.O.P.Test
SLM: Board Talley Correction Hours on BHA 60.5

DAILYCOSTS DAILY CUMULATIVE DAILY CUMULATIVE
Road &Location (gravel) Mud

RigCost Trucking-Mud disposal
Fuel Trucking
Casing(Surface) Super.

Cementing wire line

Bits Geologist

DownholeRental Pason
DirectionalEquipment zeco

sur, rentals liv,qtrs,
Directional WlH equipment
Water Casingcrew

Mob/demob Floatequipment
Communication welding &misc, insp,

Total Cost

DETAILS:

Start End Hrs
6:00 9:30 3.50 LayDownDrillPipe&dcs, pullwearring
9:30 11:00 1.50 rigup americanboring&casinghold safetymeeting
11:00 16:00 5.00 run151jointsofcasingshoe @ 6232'floatcollar@ 6191'
16:00 18:00 2.00 rig downcasingequipment
18:00 21:00 3.00 cementIsafetymeetingpress test tl4200# pump10 bblsh20spacer/ 20bb\smudcleaner10 bb\ss,h20spacer

496 sxs, cement/slurrywgt,12.5 yield2.15 11.36 water6 gpm,134.43 bbls,mixwaterf/total326.53 bbls,
slurrypumpeddropedplugdisplacement96.1bb|streatedwater bumpedplug@ 1600 psiheld 5 min1 bblbleed
backrigdowncementers

21:00 3:00 6.50 nippledownbopset slipsw/76000#tension cutcasinginstaall tubinghead &test,
3:00 6:00 3.00 start riggingdownget readyfltrucks

release riq6:00thisam,

Total 24.50

Reportby JimHogue Date August24,



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-76335 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 MIDDLE MESA 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC

9. API NUMBER:
 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 600 17th Street Ste 1900S , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 SOUTH PINE RIDGE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1873 FSL 1795 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.0S Range: 25.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 SAN JUAN 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

9/9/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Patara Oil & Gas LLC (Patara) intends to begin completion operations on the
subject well, and proposes the following procedures: Perforate the La Sal

Sandstone 6,152 - 6,158 feet - 2spf 6,131 - 6,135 feet - 2spf 6,116 - 6,128
feet - 2spf Drop 44 bio-balls. Fracture stimulate well with 66,000lbs N2 foam

with 3,000#/ft 20/40 proppant. Set frac plug at 5,900 feet. Perforate the
Honaker Trial 1 Sandstone 5,775 - 5,779 feet - 2spf 5,745 - 5,764 feet - 2spf

5,607 - 5,611 feet - 2spf Drop 54 bio-balls. Fracture stimulate well with
67,500lbs CO2foam with 2,500#/ft 20/40 proppant. Shut in well 12 hours

prior to commencing flowback. Tubing to be hung at 5,550 feet. A completion
report will follow shortly. Please see attached documents for further detail. Work is scheduled to begin

September 9, 2011. Please contact Christopher Noonan with Patara with any questions. Thank you.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Christopher Noonan 303 563-5377

TITLE
 Production Technician

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 9/1/2011

09/20/2011

Sep. 01, 2011

Sundry Number: 18098 API Well Number: 43037319070000Federal Approval of this
Action is Necessary

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAS7E6DE55IGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. MIDDLE MESA

1.TYPE OF VVELL 8.VVELLNAMEand NUMBER:
Gas Viell MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street Ste 1900S , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685 E×t SOUTH PINE RIDGE

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SAN JUAN

1873 FSL 1795 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.05 Range: 25.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

9/9/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Patara Oil & Gas LLC (Patara) intends to begin completion operations on the
subject well, and proposes the following procedures: Perforate the La Sal

Sandstone 6,152 - 6,158 feet - 2spf 6,131 - 6,135 feet - 2spf 6,116 - 6,128 Accepted by the
feet - 2spf Drop 44 bio-balls. Fracture stimulate well with 66,000lbs N2 foam Utah Division of

with 3,000#/ft 20/40 proppant. Set frac plug at 5,900 feet. Perforate the Oil, Gas and Mining
Honaker Trial 1 Sandstone 5,775 - 5,779 feet - 2spf 5,745 - 5,764 feet - 2spf 09/20/29 15,607 - 5,611 feet - 2spf Drop 54 bio-balls. Fracture stimulate well with Date:

67,500lbs CO2foam with 2,500#/ft 20/40 proppant. Shut in well 12 hours
prior to commencing flowback. Tubing to be hung at 5,550 feet. A completiSly:

report will follow shortly. Please see attached documents for further detail. Work is scheduled to begin
September 9, 2011. Please contact Christopher Noonan with Patara with any questions. Thank you.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Christopher Noonan 303 563-5377 Production Technician

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A

Federal Approval of this
Action is Necessary

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAS7E6DE55IGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. MIDDLE MESA

1.TYPE OF VVELL 8.VVELLNAMEand NUMBER:
Gas Viell MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street Ste 1900S , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685 E×t SOUTH PINE RIDGE

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SAN JUAN

1873 FSL 1795 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.05 Range: 25.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

9/9/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Patara Oil & Gas LLC (Patara) intends to begin completion operations on the
subject well, and proposes the following procedures: Perforate the La Sal

Sandstone 6,152 - 6,158 feet - 2spf 6,131 - 6,135 feet - 2spf 6,116 - 6,128 Accepted by the
feet - 2spf Drop 44 bio-balls. Fracture stimulate well with 66,000lbs N2 foam Utah Division of

with 3,000#/ft 20/40 proppant. Set frac plug at 5,900 feet. Perforate the Oil, Gas and Mining
Honaker Trial 1 Sandstone 5,775 - 5,779 feet - 2spf 5,745 - 5,764 feet - 2spf 09/20/29 15,607 - 5,611 feet - 2spf Drop 54 bio-balls. Fracture stimulate well with Date:

67,500lbs CO2foam with 2,500#/ft 20/40 proppant. Shut in well 12 hours
prior to commencing flowback. Tubing to be hung at 5,550 feet. A completiSly:

report will follow shortly. Please see attached documents for further detail. Work is scheduled to begin
September 9, 2011. Please contact Christopher Noonan with Patara with any questions. Thank you.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Christopher Noonan 303 563-5377 Production Technician

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



MIDDLE MESA 31-33-29-25 
NW SE Section 31-T29N-R25E 

San Juan County, Utah 
 
 

Perforation and Fracture Stimulation Recommendation 
 
La Sal Sandstone 
 

Perforate 2 spf w/ hollow carrier csg gun at 120 degree phasing: 
 
6152 - 6158’    6’  12 holes MFT showed 2374 psi 
6131 - 6135’    4’    8 holes MFT tested tight 
6116 - 6128’  12’  24 holes MFT tested tight 
   22’  44 
 
Recommend 70Q N2 foam frac using 3000#/ft 20/40 proppant (66,000#). 
Want to pump 44 bio-balls w/ foam to break down perfs prior to pad. 
All water to be used will be 6% KCL. 
SD 1 hr if necessary if complete ball off. 
Tag Pad & 1 ppg, 2 ppg, 3&4 ppg stages w/ 3 isotopes. 
Flush w/ N2 foam 

 
Operator will install frac plug @ 5900’ +/-. 
 
Honaker Trail 1 Sandstone 
 
 Perforate 2 spf w/ hollow carrier csg gun at 120 degree phasing: 
 
 5775 - 5779’    4’    8 holes MFT bad test 
 5745 - 5764’   19’  38 holes MFT showed 1709 psi 
 5607 - 5611’    4’    8 holes MFT showed tight 
    27’  54 
 

Recommend 70Q CO2 foam frac using 2500#/ft 20/40 proppant (67,500#). 
Want to pump 54 bio-balls w/ foam to break down perfs prior to pad. 
All water to be used will be 6% KCL. 
SD 1 hr if necessary if complete ball off. 
Tag Pad & 1 ppg, 2 ppg, 3&4 ppg stages w/ 3 isotopes. 
Flush w/ CO2 foam 

 

Sep. 01, 2011

Sundry Number: 18098 API Well Number: 43037319070000

MIDDLE MESA 31-33-29-25
NW SE Section 31-T29N-R25E

San Juan County, Utah

Perforation and Fracture Stimulation Recommendation

La Sal Sandstone

Perforate 2 spf w/ hollow carrier csg gun at 120 degree phasing:

6152 - 6158' 6' 12 holes MFT showed 2374 psi
6131 - 6135' 4' 8 holes MFT tested tight
6116 - 6128' 12' 24 holes MFT tested tight

22' 44

Recommend 70Q N2 foam frac using 3000#lft 20/40 proppant (66,000#).
Want to pump 44 bio-balls w/ foam to break down perfs prior to pad.
Allwater to be used will be 6% KCL.
SD 1 hr if necessary if complete ball off.
Tag Pad & 1 ppg, 2 ppg, 3&4 ppg stages w/ 3 isotopes.
Flush w/ N2 foam

Operator will install frac plug @5900' +/-.

Honaker Trail 1 Sandstone

Perforate 2 spf w/ hollow carrier csg gun at 120 degree phasing:

5775 - 5779' 4' 8 holes MFT bad test
5745 - 5764' 19' 38 holes MFT showed 1709 psi
5607 - 5611' 4' 8 holes MFT showed tight

27' 54

Recommend 70Q CO2 foam frac using 2500#lft 20/40 proppant (67,500#).
Want to pump 54 bio-balls w/ foam to break down perfs prior to pad.
Allwater to be used will be 6% KCL.
SD 1 hr if necessary if complete ball off.
Tag Pad & 1 ppg, 2 ppg, 3&4 ppg stages w/ 3 isotopes.
Flush w/ CO2

MIDDLE MESA 31-33-29-25
NW SE Section 31-T29N-R25E

San Juan County, Utah

Perforation and Fracture Stimulation Recommendation

La Sal Sandstone

Perforate 2 spf w/ hollow carrier csg gun at 120 degree phasing:

6152 - 6158' 6' 12 holes MFT showed 2374 psi
6131 - 6135' 4' 8 holes MFT tested tight
6116 - 6128' 12' 24 holes MFT tested tight

22' 44

Recommend 70Q N2 foam frac using 3000#lft 20/40 proppant (66,000#).
Want to pump 44 bio-balls w/ foam to break down perfs prior to pad.
Allwater to be used will be 6% KCL.
SD 1 hr if necessary if complete ball off.
Tag Pad & 1 ppg, 2 ppg, 3&4 ppg stages w/ 3 isotopes.
Flush w/ N2 foam

Operator will install frac plug @5900' +/-.

Honaker Trail 1 Sandstone

Perforate 2 spf w/ hollow carrier csg gun at 120 degree phasing:

5775 - 5779' 4' 8 holes MFT bad test
5745 - 5764' 19' 38 holes MFT showed 1709 psi
5607 - 5611' 4' 8 holes MFT showed tight

27' 54

Recommend 70Q CO2 foam frac using 2500#lft 20/40 proppant (67,500#).
Want to pump 54 bio-balls w/ foam to break down perfs prior to pad.
Allwater to be used will be 6% KCL.
SD 1 hr if necessary if complete ball off.
Tag Pad & 1 ppg, 2 ppg, 3&4 ppg stages w/ 3 isotopes.
Flush w/ CO2



MIDDLE MESA 31-33-29-25 
NW SE Section 31-T29N-R25E 

San Juan County, Utah 
 

Recommended Completion Procedure 
J. Warren 8/30/2011 

 
Well Data: 
 
KB: 6685’ 
GL: 6663’ 
 
Surface Casing: 8 5/8” J-55 32#/ft set at 2715 ft. 

Cemented w/ 425 sxs Premium Lite 11.6 ppg followed by 125 sxs Type II 
14.2 ppg w/ returns to surface. 

 
Production Casing: 4 ½” N-80 11.60#/ft LT&C set at 6500 ft. 
   Cemented w/ 496 sxs 12.5 ppg cement. 
   Capacity:  0.0155 bbls/ft 
 
CBL to be run by Lone Wolf on 8/30/2011. 
 
Tubing head:  Wood Group 
   11” 5K x 4 1/16” 10K, tested at 5000 psi. 
   2 – 2 1/16” 10K ball valves. 
 
Recommended Completion Procedure 
 

1. Fill cellar and rat / mouse holes.  Blade location.  Hole is full of treated water.  
Weatherford ran the open hole logs and should provide a copy to the field.  RU Lone 
Wolf and run a CBL from PBTD to TOC.  RU rig pump and pressure up on casing to 
2000 psi.  Make a 2nd pass on the CBL from PBTD to surface pipe.  RD Lone Wolf 
Wireline.  Keep a copy of the CBL on site for later use. 

 
2. Unload 6300’ of 2 3/8” J-55 4.7#/ft 8rd EUE tubing to be shipped from Bourland & 

Leverich (Chad Grimes 970-324-0454). 
 

3. RU Monument workover rig and equipment.  NU BOPE.  MU 4 ½” csg scraper and TIH 
on tbg to PBTD. 
 

4. RU N2 Unit and unload fluid from hole.  TOOH w/ tbg and LD csg scraper. ND BOPE 
and NU frac head. 
 

5. RU Lone Wolf Wireline.  RU lubricator and pressure up on well to 1000 psi w/ N2.  RIH 
w/ hollow carrier casing guns and perforate the La Sal Sandstone 2 spf w/ 120 degree 
phasing: 
 
 

Sep. 01, 2011

Sundry Number: 18098 API Well Number: 43037319070000

MIDDLE MESA 31-33-29-25
NW SE Section 31-T29N-R25E

San Juan County, Utah

Recommended Completion Procedure
J. Warren 8/30/2011

Well Data:

KB: 6685'
GL: 6663'

Surface Casing: 8 5/8" J-55 32#lft set at 2715 ft.
Cemented w/ 425 sxs Premium Lite 11.6 ppg followed by 125 sxs Type Il
14.2 ppg w/ returns to surface.

Production Casing: 4 ½" N-80 11.60#lft LT&Cset at 6500 ft.
Cemented w/ 496 sxs 12.5 ppg cement.
Capacity: 0.0155 bbls/ft

CBL to be run by Lone Wolf on 8/30/2011.

Tubing head: Wood Group
11" 5K x 4 1/16" 10K, tested at 5000 psi.
2 --2 1/16" 10K ball valves.

Recommended Completion Procedure

1. Fill cellar and rat I mouse holes. Blade location. Hole is full of treated water.
Weatherford ran the open hole logs and should provide a copy to the field. RU Lone
Wolf and run a CBL from PBTD to TOC. RU rig pump and pressure up on casing to
2000 psi. Make a 2nd pâSs on the CBL from PBTD to surface pipe. RD Lone Wolf
Wireline. Keep a copy of the CBL on site for later use.

2. Unload 6300' of 2 3/8" J-55 4.7#lft 8rd EUE tubing to be shipped from Bourland &
Leverich (Chad Grimes 970-324-0454).

3. RU Monument workover rig and equipment. NU BOPE. MU 4 ½" csg scraper and TlH
on tbg to PBTD.

4. RU N2 Unit and unload fluid from hole. TOOH w/ tbg and LD csg scraper. ND BOPE
and NU frac head.

5. RU Lone Wolf Wireline. RU lubricator and pressure up on well to 1000 psi w/ N2. RIH
w/ hollow carrier casing guns and perforate the La Sal Sandstone 2 spf w/ 120 degree

MIDDLE MESA 31-33-29-25
NW SE Section 31-T29N-R25E

San Juan County, Utah

Recommended Completion Procedure
J. Warren 8/30/2011

Well Data:

KB: 6685'
GL: 6663'

Surface Casing: 8 5/8" J-55 32#lft set at 2715 ft.
Cemented w/ 425 sxs Premium Lite 11.6 ppg followed by 125 sxs Type Il
14.2 ppg w/ returns to surface.

Production Casing: 4 ½" N-80 11.60#lft LT&Cset at 6500 ft.
Cemented w/ 496 sxs 12.5 ppg cement.
Capacity: 0.0155 bbls/ft

CBL to be run by Lone Wolf on 8/30/2011.

Tubing head: Wood Group
11" 5K x 4 1/16" 10K, tested at 5000 psi.
2 --2 1/16" 10K ball valves.

Recommended Completion Procedure

1. Fill cellar and rat I mouse holes. Blade location. Hole is full of treated water.
Weatherford ran the open hole logs and should provide a copy to the field. RU Lone
Wolf and run a CBL from PBTD to TOC. RU rig pump and pressure up on casing to
2000 psi. Make a 2nd pâSs on the CBL from PBTD to surface pipe. RD Lone Wolf
Wireline. Keep a copy of the CBL on site for later use.

2. Unload 6300' of 2 3/8" J-55 4.7#lft 8rd EUE tubing to be shipped from Bourland &
Leverich (Chad Grimes 970-324-0454).

3. RU Monument workover rig and equipment. NU BOPE. MU 4 ½" csg scraper and TlH
on tbg to PBTD.

4. RU N2 Unit and unload fluid from hole. TOOH w/ tbg and LD csg scraper. ND BOPE
and NU frac head.

5. RU Lone Wolf Wireline. RU lubricator and pressure up on well to 1000 psi w/ N2. RIH
w/ hollow carrier casing guns and perforate the La Sal Sandstone 2 spf w/ 120 degree



6152 – 6158’  6’ 12 holes  MFT showed 2374 psi 
6131 – 6135’  4’   8 holes MFT tested tight 
6116 – 6128’  12’ 24 holes MFT tested tight 

22’ 44 
 

6. RD Lone Wolf Wireline and the N2 Unit. 
 

7. MU SN, 4’ sub, retrievable pkr and TIH.  Set packer at 6100’ +/-. 
 

8. RU Phoenix Wireline and RIH w/ BHP recorders.  Take gradients every 1000’.  Shut in 
well for a 72 hr buildup.  Note:  Frac date is the 9th of September so need to plan to 
pull recorders in time to meet that date and NU well for frac.   
 

9. Set frac tanks and fill w/ 6% KCL as designated by the Baker Hughes frac 
recommendation.  Set BJ’s sandmaster and fill with 20/40 brown sand for both stages of 
the upcoming job. 
 

10. Remove BHP recorders taking gradients every 1000’ to FL then every 500’ thereafter.  
Have Phoenix send the data and plots to the Denver office. 
 

11. RU workover rig.  Kill well if necessary using 6% KCL water.  TOOH LD tubing and 
packer.  ND BOPE and NU frac head.  RD rig. 
 

12. RU Baker Hughes frac equipment, ProTechnics isotopes and Lone Wolf Wireline.  Lone 
Wolf Wireline should have perforating guns and 4 ½” Halliburton Obsidian frac plug for 
the next stage.  RU N2 trucks for stage 1 and have CO2 trucks on standby for stage 2. 

 
13. Frac the La Sal Sandstone per the frac procedure.  Breakdown the formation with 6% 

KCL water and 44 bio-balls.  Surge balls if necessary.  ProTechnics is to tag the pad & 1 
ppg, 2 ppg and the 3 & 4 ppg stages with three isotopes.  Maximum pressure limit is to 
be 6600 psi.  Flush to perfs with N2 foam. 
 

14. RIH w/ frac plug and perforating guns.  Set frac plug at 5900 ft +/-.  Perforate the 
Honaker Trail 1 formation w/ 2 spf at 120 degree phasing: 
 

o 5775 - 5779’  4’ 8   holes MFT bad test 
o 5745 - 5764’  19’ 38 holes MFT showed 1709 psi 
o 5607 - 5611’  4’  8   holes MFT showed tight 

27’ 54 
 

15. Switch out N2 trucks w/ CO2 transports.  Breakdown the formation with 6% KCL water 
and 54 bio-balls.  Surge balls if necessary.  ProTechnics is to tag the pad & 1 ppg, 2 ppg 
and the 3 & 4 ppg stages with three isotopes.  Maximum pressure limit is to be 6600 psi.  
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Flush to perfs with CO2 foam.  Take ISIP, 5 min, 10 min and 15 min pressure readings.  
SI well for 12 hrs.  RD Baker Hughes, ProTechnics and Lone Wolf Wireline. 
 

16. RU flow testers.  Open well to clean up frac load.  Record hourly readings of volumes 
and rates. 
 

17. When N2 and CO2 rates decline and fluid rates can be handled through the site 
production equipment, turn well to sales. 
 

18. Once cleaned up, RU Lone Wolf Wireline and Monument workover rig.  MU kill plug and 
set above the Honaker Trail perfs at 5560 ft +/-.  Blow down well.  RD Lone Wolf.  MU 
bit, pump off mandrel, SN, one jt tbg, SN and TIH.  Drill out kill plug and frac plug.  Push 
remnants to btm.  PU tbg to 5550 ft and pump off bit.  ND BOPE and NU tree.  Hookup 
sand trap and flowline.  Return well to sales.  Obtain oil sample and send to BJ for 
analysis. 
 

19. RD rig and clear location.  Hook up diesel tanks and injection equipment to inject down 
the annulus.  Commence scheduled paraffin cutting operations. 
 

20. After a few weeks, RU ProTechnics and RIH w/ a Scanalog and Completion Profiler.  Be 
sure that ProTechnics is looking for all three phases: oil, gas and water. 
 

21. Will plan to leave the tbg hung at 5550’ until such time that there is intent to open the 
Honaker Trail 2 & 3 sands. 
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RECEIVED
ÛÛIÛ ÛÌÌ AMENDED REPORT Ü FORM 8

U§tCES (highlight changes)
Ò1 AND MINING DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MININ(5. LEASE DESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER:

UTU84218

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

1a. TYPE OF WELL: ELLL GWAESLL DRY OTHER 7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
NEWL HORZ. EEP- -TRY DRSFŸR.

OTHER Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Patara Oil & Gas LLC 4303731907
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT

600 17h St. Ste. 1900S city Denver STATE CO zi 80202 (303) 825-0685 Pine Ridge South
4. LOCATIONOF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

ATSURFACE: 1873' FSL 1795' FEL Sec. 31 T29S R25E (6 MERIDIAN:

NWSE 31 29S 25E S
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVALREPORTED BELOW: 1688' FSL 1943' FWL Sec. 31 T29S R25E

AT TOTALDEPTH: 1653' FSL 19 FWL Sec. 31 T29S R25E
12.Sca

Juan
13. STATE

UTAH
14. DATE SPUDDED: 15. DATET.D. REACHED: 16. DATE COMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL):

8/9/2011 8/21/2011 9/13/2011 ABANDONED READYTOPRODUCE 6662 GL
18. TOTAL DEPTH: MD 6,247 19. PLUG BACKT.D.: MD 6,205 20. IF MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS, HOW MANY?* 21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD

TVD 5.93 TVD 5 891 2 PLUG SET:
TVD

22. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER M CHANICALLOGS RUN (Submît copy of each) 23.

WAS WELL CORED? NO YES (Submit analysis)LOGS WILL BE SEND TO THE DOGM
WAS DST RUN? NO YES (Submit report)

DIRECTIONALSURVEY? NO YES (Submit copy)

24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in well)

HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE WEIGHT (#/ft.) TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) STAGE CEMHENTER CNEOONF
S

CKES VOLSUœM
BBL) CEMENT TOP ** AMOUNTPULLED

16 16 Con 0 60 G 50 0 CIR
12.25 8.625 J-55 32 0 2,710 Pm Lt 525 0 CIR
7.875 4.5 N-80 11.6 0 6,232 III 49T 1160 CBL

25. TUBING RECORD

SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

2.375 | 5,507
26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD

FORMATIONNAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM(TVD) INTERVAL(Top/Bot - MD) SIZE NO. HOLES PERFORATION STATUS

(A) Honaker Trail 5,607 5,779 5,60i 5,611 .34 9 open Squeezed

(B) La Sal 6,116 6,158 5,Ì45 5,Í64 .34 39 open Squeezed

(C) 5,ÏÌ9 .34 9 open Squeezed

(D) 6,116 6,1ž8 .34 25 open Squeezed

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNTANDTYPE OF MATERIAL

5607 - 5611 FRAC TREATED Wl65,069#20/40 SAND AND N2 FOAM. 9/10/2011
5745 - 5764 FRAC TREATED Wl65,069# 20/40 SAND AND N2 FOAM. 9/10/2011
5775 - 5779 FRAC TREATED Wl65,069# 20/40 SAND AND N2 FOAM. 9/10/2011

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

ELECTRICAL/MECHANICALLOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONALSURVEY

SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGING AND CEMENT VERIFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER:

(5/2000) (CONTINUEDON
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31. INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVALA (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:

9/13/2011 9/12/2011 24 RATES: * 79 700 34 Flow
CHOKE SIZE: TBG.PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:

32/64 170 0.71 8,860 RATES: -+ 79 700 34 Open
INTERVALB (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: -+

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OlL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

INTERVALC (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: ->

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. PI GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: ->

INTERVALD (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: -+

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

Sold
33. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION(Log) MARKERS:

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof:Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushion used, timetoolopen, flowing and shut-inpressures and recoveries.

Formation o Bo m Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (Measu
edp

Depth)

Honaker Trail 4,3T1 5,784 Honaker Trail 4,371
La Sal 5,784 6,190 La Sal 5,784

35. ADDITIONALREMARKt (Include plugg ig procedure)

6131 - 6135, 2SPF, 9 holes, 68,345#20/40 sand & N2 foam / 6152 - 6158, 2SPF, 13 holes, 68,345#20/40 sand & N2 foam

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) Christopher A. Noonan TITLE PrOduction Technician

SIGNATURE DATE 10/6/2011

This report must be submitted within 30 days of
• completing or plugging a new well • reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
• drillinghorizontal laterals from an existing well bore e significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
e recompleting to a different producing formation • drillinghydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from twoor more formations.

** ITEM24: Cement Top - Show how reported top(s)of cement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL),cement bond log (CBL),temperaturesurvey (TS))

Send to: Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

31. INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVALA (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
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tested, cushion used, timetoolopen, flowing and shut-inpressures and recoveries.

Formation o Bo m Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (Measu
edp

Depth)

Honaker Trail 4,3T1 5,784 Honaker Trail 4,371
La Sal 5,784 6,190 La Sal 5,784

35. ADDITIONALREMARKt (Include plugg ig procedure)

6131 - 6135, 2SPF, 9 holes, 68,345#20/40 sand & N2 foam / 6152 - 6158, 2SPF, 13 holes, 68,345#20/40 sand & N2 foam

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) Christopher A. Noonan TITLE PrOduction Technician

SIGNATURE DATE 10/6/2011

This report must be submitted within 30 days of
• completing or plugging a new well • reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
• drillinghorizontal laterals from an existing well bore e significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
e recompleting to a different producing formation • drillinghydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from twoor more formations.

** ITEM24: Cement Top - Show how reported top(s)of cement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL),cement bond log (CBL),temperaturesurvey (TS))

Send to: Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801
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Patara Oil & Gas, LLC
Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25

San Juan County, UT

Geodetic System: US State Plane 1927 (Exact solution)
Zone: Utah South 4303

WELL @0.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Ground Level: 0.0

Latitude: 38° 14' 7.879 N
Longitude: 109° 12' 18.241 W

Magnetic North is 10.68° East of True North (Magnetic Declination)

SECTION DETAILS

MD Inc Azi TVD +NI-S +El-W DLeg TFace VSec Target
0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0
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Crescent Directional Drilling, LP
Survey Report

Company: Patara Oil & Gas, LLC Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Project: San Juan County, UT TVD Reference: WELL@0.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Section31-T29S-R25E MDReference: WELL@0.0ft(OriginalWellElev)
Weit: Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25 North Reference: True
Wellbore: Frontier #4 Survey Calculation Method: MinimumCurvature
Design: Frontier #4 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

Project San Juan County, UT

Map System: US State Plane 1927 (Exact solution) System Datum: Mean Sea Level
Geo Datum: NAD 1927 (NADCON CONUS)
Map Zone: Utah South 4303

Site Section 31-T29S-R25E

Site Position: Northing: 579,337.34ft Latitude: 38° 14' 7.879 N
From: Lat/Long Easting: 2,659,134.43ft Longitude: 109° 12' 18.241 W
Position Uncertainty: 0.0 ft Slot Radius: " Grid Convergence: 1.41 °

Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25

Well Position +NI-S 0.0 ft Northing: 579,337.34 ft Latitude: 38° 14' 7.879 N
+El-W 0.0 ft Easting: 2,659,134.43ft Longitude: 109° 12' 18.241 W

Position Uncertainty 0.0 ft Wellhead Elevation: ft Ground Level: 0.0ft

Wellbore Frontier #4

Magnetics Model Name Sample Date Declination Dip Angle Field Strength
) (*) {nT)

IGRF2010 08/12/11 10.68 64.45 51,417

Design Frontier #4

Audit Notes:
Version: 1.0 Phase: ACTUAL Tie On Depth: 0.0

Vertical Section: Depth From (TVD) +NI-S +El-W Direction
(ft) (ft) {ft) (*)
0.0 0 0 0.0 262.56

Survey Program Date 10/05/11

From To
(ft) (ft) Survey (Wellbore) Toot Name Description

110.0 6,247.0 Final Survey Report (Frontier #4) MWD

Survey

Measureci Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth nclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(ft) (*) (•) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (*I100ft) ( I100ft) ( I100ft)
0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00

110.0 0.60 312.70 110.0 0.4 -0.4 0.4 0.55 0.55 0.00
139.0 0.30 218.00 139.0 0.4 -0.6 0.5 2.39 -1.03 -326.55

173.0 0.50 257.60 173.0 0.3 -0.8 0.7 0.97 0.59 116.47
204.0 1.20 293.10 204.0 0.4 -1.2 1.1 2.72 2.26 114.52
233.0 1.60 285.60 233.0 0.7 -1.9 1.8 1.51 1.38 -25.86

265.0 2.20 284.50 265.0 0.9 -2.9 2.8 1.88 1.87 -3.44

295.0 2.80 280.00 294.9 1.2 -4.2 4.0 2.10 2.00 -15.00

327.0 3.70 274.90 326.9 1.4 -6.0 5.7 2.95 2.81 -15.94

357.0 4.40 275.40 356.8 1.6 -8.1 7.8 2.34 2.33 1.67
388.0 5.30 272.80 387.7 1.8 -10.7 10.4 2.99 2.90 -8.39

418.0 6.30 273.10 417.5 2.0 -13.7 13.4 3.33 3.33 1.00
449.0 7.30 269.40 448.3 2.0 -17.4 17.0 3.52 3.23 -11.94
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Crescent Directional Drilling, LP
Survey Report

Company: Patara Oil & Gas, LLC Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Project: San Juan County, UT TVD Reference: WELL@0.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Section31-T29S-R25E MDReference: WELL@0.0ft(OriginalWellElev)
Weit: Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25 North Reference: True
Wellbore: Frontier #4 Survey Calculation Method: MinimumCurvature
Design: Frontier #4 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

Project San Juan County, UT

Map System: US State Plane 1927 (Exact solution) System Datum: Mean Sea Level
Geo Datum: NAD 1927 (NADCON CONUS)
Map Zone: Utah South 4303
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Position Uncertainty 0.0 ft Wellhead Elevation: ft Ground Level: 0.0ft

Wellbore Frontier #4

Magnetics Model Name Sample Date Declination Dip Angle Field Strength
) (*) {nT)

IGRF2010 08/12/11 10.68 64.45 51,417

Design Frontier #4

Audit Notes:
Version: 1.0 Phase: ACTUAL Tie On Depth: 0.0

Vertical Section: Depth From (TVD) +NI-S +El-W Direction
(ft) (ft) {ft) (*)
0.0 0 0 0.0 262.56

Survey Program Date 10/05/11

From To
(ft) (ft) Survey (Wellbore) Toot Name Description

110.0 6,247.0 Final Survey Report (Frontier #4) MWD

Survey

Measureci Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth nclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(ft) (*) (•) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (*I100ft) ( I100ft) ( I100ft)
0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00

110.0 0.60 312.70 110.0 0.4 -0.4 0.4 0.55 0.55 0.00
139.0 0.30 218.00 139.0 0.4 -0.6 0.5 2.39 -1.03 -326.55

173.0 0.50 257.60 173.0 0.3 -0.8 0.7 0.97 0.59 116.47
204.0 1.20 293.10 204.0 0.4 -1.2 1.1 2.72 2.26 114.52
233.0 1.60 285.60 233.0 0.7 -1.9 1.8 1.51 1.38 -25.86

265.0 2.20 284.50 265.0 0.9 -2.9 2.8 1.88 1.87 -3.44

295.0 2.80 280.00 294.9 1.2 -4.2 4.0 2.10 2.00 -15.00

327.0 3.70 274.90 326.9 1.4 -6.0 5.7 2.95 2.81 -15.94

357.0 4.40 275.40 356.8 1.6 -8.1 7.8 2.34 2.33 1.67
388.0 5.30 272.80 387.7 1.8 -10.7 10.4 2.99 2.90 -8.39
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Crescent Directional Drilling, LP
Survey Report

Company: Patara Oil &Gas, LLC Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Project: San Juan County, UT TVD Reference: WELL@0.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Section 31-T29S-R25E MD Reference: WELL@0.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Well: Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25 North Reference: True
Wellbore: Frontier #4 Survey Calculation Method: MinimumCurvature
Design: Frontier #4 Database: EDM2003.16 Single User Db

Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(ft) (*) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (*I100ft) (°Ii00ft) (*I100ft)

480.0 8.30 268.50 479.0 1.9 -21.6 21.2 3.25 3.23 -2.90

511.0 9.50 267.70 509.7 1.8 -26.4 25.9 3.89 3.87 -2.58

541.0 10.60 266.50 539.2 1.5 -31.6 31.2 3.73 3.67 -4.00

572.0 11.70 266.50 569.6 1.2 -37.6 37.1 3.55 3.55 0.00
603.0 12.90 264.50 599.9 0.6 -44.2 43.7 4.11 3.87 -6.45

634.0 14.30 264.50 630.0 -0.1 -51.5 51.0 4.52 4.52 0.00
664.0 15.60 265.30 659.0 -0.8 -59.2 58.8 4.39 4.33 2.67
695.0 16.80 265.00 688.8 -1.5 -67.8 67.4 3.88 3.87 -0.97

726.0 17.90 264.30 718.4 -2.3 -77.0 76.6 3.61 3.55 -2.26

756.0 18.90 263.40 746.8 -3.4 -86.4 86.1 3.47 3.33 -3.00

787.0 19.90 262.70 776.1 -4.6 -96.6 96.4 3.31 3.23 -2.26

818.0 20.70 262.50 805.2 -6.0 -107.3 107.2 2.59 2.58 -0.65

849.0 21.70 261.80 834.1 -7.5 -118.4 118.4 3.33 3.23 -2.26

879.0 22.50 261.60 861.9 -9.2 -129.6 129.7 2.68 2.67 -0.67

910.0 23.30 261.90 890.4 -10.9 -141.5 141.7 2.61 2.58 0.97
941.0 24.20 262.80 918.8 -12.6 -153.9 154.2 3.13 2.90 2.90
972.0 24.50 262.50 947.0 -14.2 -166.5 167.0 1.05 0.97 -0.97

1,003.0 24.70 261.90 975.2 -15.9 -179.3 179.9 1.03 0.65 -1.94

1,034.0 25.40 261.90 1,003.3 -17.8 -192.3 193.0 2.26 2.26 0.00
1,064.0 25.80 261.60 1,030.4 -19.6 -205.2 206.0 1.40 1.33 -1.00

1,128.0 26.80 261.50 1,087.7 -23.8 -233.2 234.3 1.56 1.56 -0.16

1,160.0 27.30 262.20 1,116.2 -25.9 -247.6 248.9 1.85 1.56 2.19
1,191.0 27.20 263.60 1,143.8 -27.6 -261.7 263.1 2.09 -0.32 4.52
1,223.0 26.50 265.00 1,172.3 -29.1 -276.1 277.5 2.95 -2.19 4.37
1,255.0 26.70 266.20 1,201.0 -30.2 -290.4 291.8 1.79 0.62 3.75
1,286.0 27.30 265.90 1,228.6 -31.1 -304.4 305.9 1.98 1.94 -0.97

1,318.0 27.90 265.80 1,256.9 -32.2 -319.2 320.7 1.88 1.87 -0.31

1,349.0 28.50 265.50 1,284.3 -33.3 -333.8 335.3 1.99 1.94 -0.97

1,381.0 29.10 264.60 1,312.3 -34.7 -349.1 350.7 2.31 1.87 -2.81

1,413.0 28.80 264.90 1,340.3 -36.1 -364.6 366.2 1.04 -0.94 0.94
1,445.0 27.40 264.70 1,368.5 -37.4 -379.6 381.2 4.38 -4.37 -0.62

1,477.0 26.70 264.60 1,397.0 -38.8 -394.1 395.8 2.19 -2.19 -0.31

1,508.0 26.40 264.80 1,424.8 -40.1 -407.9 409.6 1.01 -0.97 0.65
1,540.0 26.10 266.00 1,453.5 -41.2 -422.0 423.8 1.91 -0.94 3.75
1,572.0 26.50 266.10 1,482.1 -42.2 -436.1 437.9 1.26 1.25 0.31
1,604.0 27.30 265.80 1,510.7 -43.2 -450.6 452.4 2.54 2.50 -0.94

1,636.0 27.90 266.20 1,539.0 -44.2 -465.3 467.2 1.96 1.87 1.25
1,666.0 28.50 266.70 1,565.5 -45.1 -479.5 481.3 2.15 2.00 1.67
1,698.0 27.70 266.90 1,593.7 -46.0 -494.5 496.3 2.52 -2.50 0.62
1,730.0 27.70 267.60 1,622.0 -46.7 -509.4 511.2 1.02 0.00 2.19
1,762.0 28.30 268.30 1,650.3 -47.2 -524.4 526.1 2.14 1.87 2.19
1,794.0 28.70 267.40 1,678.4 -47.8 -539.7 541.3 1.83 1.25 -2.81

1,825.0 27.40 266.70 1,705.8 -48.5 -554.2 555.9 4.33 -4.19 -2.26

1,857.0 27.30 265.90 1,734.2 -49.5 -568.9 570.5 1.19 -0.31 -2.50

1,888.0 27.90 265.50 1,761.7 -50.6 -583.2 584.9 2.03 1.94 -1.29

1,920.0 28.30 266.00 1,789.9 -51.7 -598.3 599.9 1.45 1.25 1.56
1,952.0 28.90 265.30 1,818.0 -52.8 -613.5 615.2 2.15 1.87 -2.19

1,984.0 29.50 265.10 1,845.9 -54.1 -629.1 630.8 1.90 1.87 -0.62

2,016.0 29.80 264.20 1,873.7 -55.6 -644.8 646.6 1.68 0.94 -2.81

2,047.0 30.20 263.30 1,900.6 -57.3 -660.3 662.1 1.94 1.29 -2.90

2,079.0 30.40 262.40 1,928.2 -59.3 -676.3 678.3 1.55 0.62 -2.81

2,110.0 30.70 262.30 1,954.9 -61.4 -691.9 694.0 0.98 0.97 -0.32

2,142.0 29.90 262.00 1,982.5 -63.6 -707.9 710.2 2.54 -2.50 -0.94

2,174.0 28.60 261.80 2,010.5 -65.8 -723.4 725.8 4.07 -4.06 -0.62
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Crescent Directional Drilling, LP
Survey Report

Company: Patara Oil &Gas, LLC Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Project: San Juan County, UT TVD Reference: WELL@0.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Section 31-T29S-R25E MD Reference: WELL@0.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Well: Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25 North Reference: True
Wellbore: Frontier #4 Survey Calculation Method: MinimumCurvature
Design: Frontier #4 Database: EDM2003.16 Single User Db

Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(ft) (*) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (*I100ft) (°Ii00ft) (*I100ft)
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572.0 11.70 266.50 569.6 1.2 -37.6 37.1 3.55 3.55 0.00
603.0 12.90 264.50 599.9 0.6 -44.2 43.7 4.11 3.87 -6.45

634.0 14.30 264.50 630.0 -0.1 -51.5 51.0 4.52 4.52 0.00
664.0 15.60 265.30 659.0 -0.8 -59.2 58.8 4.39 4.33 2.67
695.0 16.80 265.00 688.8 -1.5 -67.8 67.4 3.88 3.87 -0.97
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910.0 23.30 261.90 890.4 -10.9 -141.5 141.7 2.61 2.58 0.97
941.0 24.20 262.80 918.8 -12.6 -153.9 154.2 3.13 2.90 2.90
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1,128.0 26.80 261.50 1,087.7 -23.8 -233.2 234.3 1.56 1.56 -0.16

1,160.0 27.30 262.20 1,116.2 -25.9 -247.6 248.9 1.85 1.56 2.19
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1,445.0 27.40 264.70 1,368.5 -37.4 -379.6 381.2 4.38 -4.37 -0.62
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1,572.0 26.50 266.10 1,482.1 -42.2 -436.1 437.9 1.26 1.25 0.31
1,604.0 27.30 265.80 1,510.7 -43.2 -450.6 452.4 2.54 2.50 -0.94
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1,794.0 28.70 267.40 1,678.4 -47.8 -539.7 541.3 1.83 1.25 -2.81

1,825.0 27.40 266.70 1,705.8 -48.5 -554.2 555.9 4.33 -4.19 -2.26

1,857.0 27.30 265.90 1,734.2 -49.5 -568.9 570.5 1.19 -0.31 -2.50

1,888.0 27.90 265.50 1,761.7 -50.6 -583.2 584.9 2.03 1.94 -1.29

1,920.0 28.30 266.00 1,789.9 -51.7 -598.3 599.9 1.45 1.25 1.56
1,952.0 28.90 265.30 1,818.0 -52.8 -613.5 615.2 2.15 1.87 -2.19

1,984.0 29.50 265.10 1,845.9 -54.1 -629.1 630.8 1.90 1.87 -0.62

2,016.0 29.80 264.20 1,873.7 -55.6 -644.8 646.6 1.68 0.94 -2.81

2,047.0 30.20 263.30 1,900.6 -57.3 -660.3 662.1 1.94 1.29 -2.90

2,079.0 30.40 262.40 1,928.2 -59.3 -676.3 678.3 1.55 0.62 -2.81

2,110.0 30.70 262.30 1,954.9 -61.4 -691.9 694.0 0.98 0.97 -0.32

2,142.0 29.90 262.00 1,982.5 -63.6 -707.9 710.2 2.54 -2.50 -0.94

2,174.0 28.60 261.80 2,010.5 -65.8 -723.4 725.8 4.07 -4.06 -0.62

10/05/11 11:47:33AM Page 3 COMPASS 2003.16 Build



Crescent Directional Drilling, LP
Survey Report

Company: Patara Oil & Gas, LLC Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Project: San Juan County, UT TVD Reference: WELL @0.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Section 31-T29S-R25E MDReference: WELL @0.0ft (OriginalWell Elev)
Well: Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25 North Reference: True
Wellbore: Frontier #4 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Frontier #4 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(ft) (*) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°l100ft) (*l100ft) (*l100ft)

2,205.0 28.30 261.20 2,037.7 -68.0 -738.0 740.6 1.34 -0.97 -1.94

2,236.0 28.70 261.10 2,065.0 -70.3 -752.6 755.4 1.30 1.29 -0.32

2,268.0 29.30 261.30 2,092.9 -72.7 -767.9 770.9 1.90 1.87 0.62
2,300.0 29.90 261.00 2,120.8 -75.1 -783.5 786.7 1.93 1.87 -0.94

2,332.0 30.60 261.60 2,148.4 -77.5 -799.5 802.8 2.38 2.19 1.87
2,364.0 30.40 261.10 2,176.0 -80.0 -815.5 819.0 1.01 -0.62 -1.56

2,395.0 29.60 260.50 2,202.8 -82.4 -830.8 834.5 2.76 -2.58 -1.94

2,427.0 29.00 260.70 2,230.7 -85.0 -846.3 850.2 1.90 -1.87 0.62
2,459.0 28.80 259.00 2,258.7 -87.7 -861.5 865.6 2.64 -0.62 -5.31

2,490.0 28.90 258.20 2,285.9 -90.7 -876.2 880.5 1.29 0.32 -2.58

2,522.0 28.40 257.60 2,314.0 -93.9 -891.2 895.8 1.80 -1.56 -1.87

2,554.0 27.30 256.80 2,342.3 -97.2 -905.7 910.7 3.63 -3.44 -2.50

2,586.0 26.20 256.20 2,370.8 -100.6 -919.7 925.0 3.54 -3.44 -1.87

2,644.0 24.90 257.10 2,423.2 -106.4 -944.1 949.9 2.34 -2.24 1.55
2,742.0 24.30 255.50 2,512.3 -116.0 -983.7 990.5 0.91 -0.61 -1.63

2,774.0 23.30 257.20 2,541.6 -119.1 -996.3 1,003.3 3.79 -3.12 5.31
2,805.0 21.50 259.70 2,570.2 -121.4

-1,007.8 1,015.1 6.57 -5.81 8.06
2,837.0 19.90 261.70 2,600.2 -123.3

-1,019.0 1,026.4 5.47 -5.00 6.25
2,869.0 18.90 264.30 2,630.3 -124.6

-1,029.5 1,037.0 4.13 -3.12 8.12
2,900.0 18.70 266.50 2,659.7 -125.4 -1,039.5 1,047.0 2.38 -0.65 7.10
2,932.0 18.70 268.50 2,690.0 -125.8

-1,049.7 1,057.2 2.00 0.00 6.25
2,964.0 18.50 268.70 2,720.3 -126.1

-1,059.9 1,067.3 0.66 -0.62 0.62
2,996.0 18.10 268.00 2,750.7 -126.4

-1,070.0 1,077.3 1.43 -1.25 -2.19

3,027.0 18.60 268.30 2,780.1 -126.7
-1,079.7 1,087.1 1.64 1.61 0.97

3,058.0 19.20 270.20 2,809.5 -126.8
-1,089.8 1,097.0 2.77 1.94 6.13

3,090.0 19.30 270.40 2,839.7 -126.7
-1,100.3 1,107.5 0.37 0.31 0.62

3,122.0 19.10 269.50 2,869.9 -126.8
-1,110.9 1,117.9 1.12 -0.62 -2.81

3,153.0 18.60 267.80 2,899.2 -127.0
-1,120.9 1,127.9 2.40 -1.61 -5.48

3,216.0 18.80 267.00 2,958.9 -127.9
-1,141.0 1,148.0 0.52 0.32 -1.27

3,279.0 19.20 268.50 3,018.5 -128.7
-1,161.5 1,168.4 1.00 0.63 2.38

3,343.0 18.40 265.70 3,079.1 -129.7
-1,182.1 1,189.0 1.88 -1.25 -4.37

3,407.0 18.20 264.00 3,139.8 -131.5
-1,202.1 1,209.1 0.89 -0.31 -2.66

3,469.0 18.10 260.70 3,198.7 -134.1
-1,221.3 1,228.4 1.67 -0.16 -5.32

3,532.0 18.00 260.20 3,258.6 -137.3
-1,240.5 1,247.9 0.29 -0.16 -0.79

3,564.0 17.30 259.30 3,289.1 -139.1
-1,250.1 1,257.6 2.35 -2.19 -2.81

3,596.0 17.50 261.70 3,319.7 -140.6
-1,259.5 1,267.1 2.33 0.62 7.50

3,627.0 17.90 265.20 3,349.2 -141.7
-1,268.9 1,276.5 3.67 1.29 11.29

3,658.0 18.20 266.50 3,378.7 -142.4
-1,278.5 1,286.1 1.62 0.97 4.19

3,690.0 18.00 266.20 3,409.1 -143.0
-1,288.4 1,296.0 0.69 -0.62 -0.94

3,722.0 17.90 264.70 3,439.5 -143.8
-1,298.2 1,305.9 1.48 -0.31 -4.69

3,753.0 18.10 267.50 3,469.0 -144.5
-1,307.8 1,315.5 2.86 0.65 9.03

3,785.0 18.40 270.20 3,499.4 -144.7
-1,317.8 1,325.4 2.80 0.94 8.44

3,817.0 18.50 271.20 3,529.8 -144.6
-1,327.9 1,335.4 1.04 0.31 3.12

3,848.0 18.50 270.50 3,559.2 -144.4
-1,337.7 1,345.2 0.72 0.00 -2.26

3,880.0 18.40 269.50 3,589.5 -144.4
-1,347.9 1,355.2 1.04 -0.31 -3.12

3,911.0 18.20 269.00 3,618.9 -144.5
-1,357.6 1,364.9 0.82 -0.65 -1.61

3,943.0 18.10 268.90 3,649.4 -144.7
-1,367.6 1,374.8 0.33 -0.31 -0.31

3,974.0 17.70 269.20 3,678.9 -144.9
-1,377.1 1,384.3 1.32 -1.29 0.97

4,006.0 17.50 268.10 3,709.4 -145.1
-1,386.8 1,393.9 1.21 -0.62 -3.44

4,038.0 17.20 266.30 3,739.9 -145.6
-1,396.3 1,403.4 1.92 -0.94 -5.62

4,069.0 17.00 265.10 3,769.5 -146.3
-1,405.4 1,412.5 1.31 -0.65 -3.87

4,101.0 16.60 263.60 3,800.2 -147.2
-1,414.6 1,421.7 1.84 -1.25 -4.69

4,133.0 16.20 267.00 3,830.9 -147.9
-1,423.6 1,430.8 3.25 -1.25 10.62

4,164.0 16.00 269.10 3,860.6 -148.2
-1,432.2 1,439.3 1.99 -0.65 6.77
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Crescent Directional Drilling, LP
Survey Report

Company: Patara Oil & Gas, LLC Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Project: San Juan County, UT TVD Reference: WELL @0.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Section 31-T29S-R25E MDReference: WELL @0.0ft (OriginalWell Elev)
Well: Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25 North Reference: True
Wellbore: Frontier #4 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Frontier #4 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(ft) (*) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°l100ft) (*l100ft) (*l100ft)

2,205.0 28.30 261.20 2,037.7 -68.0 -738.0 740.6 1.34 -0.97 -1.94

2,236.0 28.70 261.10 2,065.0 -70.3 -752.6 755.4 1.30 1.29 -0.32

2,268.0 29.30 261.30 2,092.9 -72.7 -767.9 770.9 1.90 1.87 0.62
2,300.0 29.90 261.00 2,120.8 -75.1 -783.5 786.7 1.93 1.87 -0.94

2,332.0 30.60 261.60 2,148.4 -77.5 -799.5 802.8 2.38 2.19 1.87
2,364.0 30.40 261.10 2,176.0 -80.0 -815.5 819.0 1.01 -0.62 -1.56

2,395.0 29.60 260.50 2,202.8 -82.4 -830.8 834.5 2.76 -2.58 -1.94

2,427.0 29.00 260.70 2,230.7 -85.0 -846.3 850.2 1.90 -1.87 0.62
2,459.0 28.80 259.00 2,258.7 -87.7 -861.5 865.6 2.64 -0.62 -5.31

2,490.0 28.90 258.20 2,285.9 -90.7 -876.2 880.5 1.29 0.32 -2.58

2,522.0 28.40 257.60 2,314.0 -93.9 -891.2 895.8 1.80 -1.56 -1.87

2,554.0 27.30 256.80 2,342.3 -97.2 -905.7 910.7 3.63 -3.44 -2.50

2,586.0 26.20 256.20 2,370.8 -100.6 -919.7 925.0 3.54 -3.44 -1.87

2,644.0 24.90 257.10 2,423.2 -106.4 -944.1 949.9 2.34 -2.24 1.55
2,742.0 24.30 255.50 2,512.3 -116.0 -983.7 990.5 0.91 -0.61 -1.63

2,774.0 23.30 257.20 2,541.6 -119.1 -996.3 1,003.3 3.79 -3.12 5.31
2,805.0 21.50 259.70 2,570.2 -121.4

-1,007.8 1,015.1 6.57 -5.81 8.06
2,837.0 19.90 261.70 2,600.2 -123.3

-1,019.0 1,026.4 5.47 -5.00 6.25
2,869.0 18.90 264.30 2,630.3 -124.6

-1,029.5 1,037.0 4.13 -3.12 8.12
2,900.0 18.70 266.50 2,659.7 -125.4 -1,039.5 1,047.0 2.38 -0.65 7.10
2,932.0 18.70 268.50 2,690.0 -125.8

-1,049.7 1,057.2 2.00 0.00 6.25
2,964.0 18.50 268.70 2,720.3 -126.1

-1,059.9 1,067.3 0.66 -0.62 0.62
2,996.0 18.10 268.00 2,750.7 -126.4

-1,070.0 1,077.3 1.43 -1.25 -2.19

3,027.0 18.60 268.30 2,780.1 -126.7
-1,079.7 1,087.1 1.64 1.61 0.97

3,058.0 19.20 270.20 2,809.5 -126.8
-1,089.8 1,097.0 2.77 1.94 6.13

3,090.0 19.30 270.40 2,839.7 -126.7
-1,100.3 1,107.5 0.37 0.31 0.62

3,122.0 19.10 269.50 2,869.9 -126.8
-1,110.9 1,117.9 1.12 -0.62 -2.81

3,153.0 18.60 267.80 2,899.2 -127.0
-1,120.9 1,127.9 2.40 -1.61 -5.48

3,216.0 18.80 267.00 2,958.9 -127.9
-1,141.0 1,148.0 0.52 0.32 -1.27

3,279.0 19.20 268.50 3,018.5 -128.7
-1,161.5 1,168.4 1.00 0.63 2.38

3,343.0 18.40 265.70 3,079.1 -129.7
-1,182.1 1,189.0 1.88 -1.25 -4.37

3,407.0 18.20 264.00 3,139.8 -131.5
-1,202.1 1,209.1 0.89 -0.31 -2.66

3,469.0 18.10 260.70 3,198.7 -134.1
-1,221.3 1,228.4 1.67 -0.16 -5.32

3,532.0 18.00 260.20 3,258.6 -137.3
-1,240.5 1,247.9 0.29 -0.16 -0.79

3,564.0 17.30 259.30 3,289.1 -139.1
-1,250.1 1,257.6 2.35 -2.19 -2.81

3,596.0 17.50 261.70 3,319.7 -140.6
-1,259.5 1,267.1 2.33 0.62 7.50

3,627.0 17.90 265.20 3,349.2 -141.7
-1,268.9 1,276.5 3.67 1.29 11.29

3,658.0 18.20 266.50 3,378.7 -142.4
-1,278.5 1,286.1 1.62 0.97 4.19

3,690.0 18.00 266.20 3,409.1 -143.0
-1,288.4 1,296.0 0.69 -0.62 -0.94

3,722.0 17.90 264.70 3,439.5 -143.8
-1,298.2 1,305.9 1.48 -0.31 -4.69

3,753.0 18.10 267.50 3,469.0 -144.5
-1,307.8 1,315.5 2.86 0.65 9.03

3,785.0 18.40 270.20 3,499.4 -144.7
-1,317.8 1,325.4 2.80 0.94 8.44

3,817.0 18.50 271.20 3,529.8 -144.6
-1,327.9 1,335.4 1.04 0.31 3.12

3,848.0 18.50 270.50 3,559.2 -144.4
-1,337.7 1,345.2 0.72 0.00 -2.26

3,880.0 18.40 269.50 3,589.5 -144.4
-1,347.9 1,355.2 1.04 -0.31 -3.12

3,911.0 18.20 269.00 3,618.9 -144.5
-1,357.6 1,364.9 0.82 -0.65 -1.61

3,943.0 18.10 268.90 3,649.4 -144.7
-1,367.6 1,374.8 0.33 -0.31 -0.31

3,974.0 17.70 269.20 3,678.9 -144.9
-1,377.1 1,384.3 1.32 -1.29 0.97

4,006.0 17.50 268.10 3,709.4 -145.1
-1,386.8 1,393.9 1.21 -0.62 -3.44

4,038.0 17.20 266.30 3,739.9 -145.6
-1,396.3 1,403.4 1.92 -0.94 -5.62

4,069.0 17.00 265.10 3,769.5 -146.3
-1,405.4 1,412.5 1.31 -0.65 -3.87

4,101.0 16.60 263.60 3,800.2 -147.2
-1,414.6 1,421.7 1.84 -1.25 -4.69

4,133.0 16.20 267.00 3,830.9 -147.9
-1,423.6 1,430.8 3.25 -1.25 10.62

4,164.0 16.00 269.10 3,860.6 -148.2
-1,432.2 1,439.3 1.99 -0.65 6.77
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Crescent Directional Drilling, LP
Survey Report

Company: Patara Oil &Gas, LLC Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Project: San Juan County, UT TVD Reference: WELL@0.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Section 31-T29S-R25E MD Reference: WELL@0.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Well: Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25 North Reference: True
Wellbore: Frontier #4 Survey Calculation Method: MinimumCurvature
Design: Frontier #4 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(ft) (*) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°I100ft) (*I100ft) (°l100ft)

4,196.0 15.80 268.70 3,891.4 -148.4
-1,440.9 1,448.0 0.71 -0.62 -1.25

4,228.0 15.60 267.70 3,922.2 -148.6
-1,449.6 1,456.6 1.05 -0.62 -3.12

4,259.0 14.70 265.40 3,952.2 -149.1
-1,457.7 1,464.7 3.49 -2.90 -7.42

4,291.0 13.30 262.40 3,983.2 -149.9
-1,465.4 1,472.5 4.93 -4.37 -9.37

4,323.0 12.40 260.10 4,014.4 -151.0
-1,472.4 1,479.6 3.23 -2.81 -7.19

4,354.0 10.80 258.70 4,044.8 -152.2
-1,478.5 1,485.8 5.24 -5.16 -4.52

4,386.0 9.50 258.00 4,076.3 -153.3
-1,484.1 1,491.4 4.08 -4.06 -2.19

4,417.0 8.10 258.40 4,106.9 -154.3
-1,488.7 1,496.1 4.52 -4.52 1.29

4,449.0 7.60 265.40 4,138.6 -154.9
-1,493.0 1,500.5 3.37 -1.56 21.87

4,481.0 7.40 272.60 4,170.3 -155.0
-1,497.2 1,504.6 3.00 -0.62 22.50

4,513.0 6.40 273.00 4,202.1 -154.8
-1,501.0 1,508.4 3.13 -3.12 1.25

4,545.0 5.40 270.20 4,233.9 -154.7
-1,504.3 1,511.7 3.25 -3.12 -8.75

4,576.0 4.10 262.60 4,264.8 -154.8
-1,506.9 1,514.2 4.65 -4.19 -24.52

4,608.0 2.80 254.60 4,296.8 -155.2
-1,508.8 1,516.1 4.32 -4.06 -25.00

4,613.9 2.65 254.02 4,302.7 -155.2
-1,509.0 1,516.4 2.56 -2.51 -9.89

MM31-33 Target 1
4,640.0 2.00 250.40 4,328.7 -155.6

-1,510.0 1,517.5 2.56 -2.50 -13.86

4,702.0 2.40 238.40 4,390.7 -156.6
-1,512.2 1,519.7 0.98 0.65 -19.35

4,765.0 3.50 239.50 4,453.6 -158.3
-1,514.9 1,522.7 1.75 1.75 1.75

4,797.0 3.80 236.40 4,485.5 -159.4
-1,516.7 1,524.5 1.12 0.94 -9.69

4,829.0 4.30 239.80 4,517.5 -160.5
-1,518.6 1,526.6 1.73 1.56 10.62

4,860.0 4.40 240.40 4,548.4 -161.7
-1,520.6 1,528.8 0.35 0.32 1.94

4,892.0 3.90 236.20 4,580.3 -162.9
-1,522.6 1,530.9 1.83 -1.56 -13.12

4,924.0 3.70 237.50 4,612.2 -164.1
-1,524.4 1,532.8 0.68 -0.62 4.06

4,956.0 3.50 240.40 4,644.1 -165.1
-1,526.1 1,534.6 0.85 -0.62 9.06

4,988.0 2.50 232.50 4,676.1 -166.0
-1,527.5 1,536.1 3.37 -3.12 -24.69

5,019.0 2.00 216.10 4,707.1 -166.9
-1,528.4 1,537.1 2.61 -1.61 -52.90

5,050.0 1.80 213.00 4,738.1 -167.7
-1,528.9 1,537.8 0.73 -0.65 -10.00

5,082.0 2.00 222.90 4,770.0 -168.6
-1,529.6 1,538.5 1.20 0.62 30.94

5,114.0 2.20 224.60 4,802.0 -169.4
-1,530.4 1,539.5 0.65 0.62 5.31

5,145.0 1.30 226.30 4,833.0 -170.1
-1,531.1 1,540.2 2.91 -2.90 5.48

5,176.0 1.40 241.40 4,864.0 -170.5
-1,531.7 1,540.8 1.19 0.32 48.71

5,208.0 2.50 239.90 4,896.0 -171.0
-1,532.6 1,541.9 3.44 3.44 -4.69

5,240.0 3.60 235.20 4,927.9 -172.0
-1,534.0 1,543.4 3.52 3.44 -14.69

5,272.0 3.80 235.60 4,959.9 -173.1
-1,535.7 1,545.2 0.63 0.62 1.25

5,303.0 3.60 236.80 4,990.8 -174.2
-1,537.4 1,547.0 0.69 -0.65 3.87

5,334.0 3.70 237.00 5,021.7 -175.3
-1,539.1 1,548.8 0.33 0.32 0.65

5,366.0 3.20 240.60 5,053.7 -176.3
-1,540.7 1,550.6 1.70 -1.56 11.25

5,398.0 3.00 246.50 5,085.6 -177.1
-1,542.2 1,552.2 1.18 -0.62 18.44

5,429.0 2.70 235.50 5,116.6 -177.8
-1,543.6 1,553.6 2.01 -0.97 -35.48

5,461.0 3.10 230.70 5,148.6 -178.8
-1,544.9 1,555.0 1.46 1.25 -15.00

5,493.0 3.10 225.50 5,180.5 -180.0
-1,546.2 1,556.5 0.88 0.00 -16.25

5,525.0 3.30 227.50 5,212.5 -181.2
-1,547.5 1,557.9 0.72 0.62 6.25

5,556.0 3.20 216.30 5,243.4 -182.5
-1,548.6 1,559.2 2.07 -0.32 -36.13

5,588.0 2.60 229.30 5,275.4 -183.7
-1,549.7 1,560.4 2.77 -1.87 40.62

5,620.0 3.00 229.20 5,307.3 -184.7
-1,550.9 1,561.8 1.25 1.25 -0.31

5,651.0 3.30 220.30 5,338.3 -185.9
-1,552.1 1,563.1 1.85 0.97 -28.71

5,683.0 3.60 209.00 5,370.2 -187.5
-1,553.2 1,564.4 2.32 0.94 -35.31

5,714.0 3.70 202.10 5,401.2 -189.3
-1,554.0 1,565.4 1.45 0.32 -22.26

5,746.0 3.20 190.40 5,433.1 -191.1
-1,554.6 1,566.2 2.69 -1.56 -36.56

5,778.0 2.40 170.20 5,465.1 -192.6
-1,554.6 1,566.5 3.93 -2.50 -63.12

5,809.0 1.30 155.50 5,496.1 -193.6
-1,554.4 1,566.3 3.84 -3.55 -47.42

5,841.0 1.20 148.50 5,528.0 -194.2
-1,554.0 1,566.1 0.57 -0.31 -21.87

5,873.0 1.30 162.10 5,560.0 -194.9
-1,553.7 1,565.9 0.98 0.31 42.50

5,904.0 1.70 179.40 5,591.0 -195.6
-1,553.6 1,565.9 1.94 1.29 55.81
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Crescent Directional Drilling, LP
Survey Report

Company: Patara Oil &Gas, LLC Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Project: San Juan County, UT TVD Reference: WELL@0.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Section 31-T29S-R25E MD Reference: WELL@0.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Well: Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25 North Reference: True
Wellbore: Frontier #4 Survey Calculation Method: MinimumCurvature
Design: Frontier #4 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(ft) (*) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°I100ft) (*I100ft) (°l100ft)
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4,449.0 7.60 265.40 4,138.6 -154.9
-1,493.0 1,500.5 3.37 -1.56 21.87
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MM31-33 Target 1
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Crescent Directional Drilling, LP
Survey Report

Company: Patara Oil &Gas, LLC Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
Project: San Juan County, UT TVD Reference: WELL@0.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Section 31-T29S-R25E MD Reference: WELL@0.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Well: Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25 North Reference: True
Wellbore: Frontier #4 Survey Calculation Method: MinimumCurvature
Design: Frontier #4 Database: EDM2003.16 Single User Db

Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(ft) (*) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (*1100ft) (*I100ft) (*I100ft)

5,936.0 2.10 180.50 5,623.0 -196.7
-1,553.6 1,566.0 1.26 1.25 3.44

5,967.0 2.70 191.70 5,654.0 -198.0
-1,553.8 1,566.3 2.45 1.94 36.13

5,999.0 3.60 202.30 5,685.9 -199.7
-1,554.3 1,567.1 3.34 2.81 33.12

6,031.0 4.40 206.90 5,717.9 -201.7
-1,555.3 1,568.3 2.69 2.50 14.37

6,063.0 4.80 210.00 5,749.8 -203.9
-1,556.5 1,569.8 1.47 1.25 9.69

6,094.0 5.40 214.20 5,780.6 -206.3
-1,557.9 1,571.5 2.28 1.94 13.55

6,126.0 5.90 216.00 5,812.5 -208.8
-1,559.8 1,573.7 1.66 1.56 5.62

6,157.0 6.40 217.40 5,843.3 -211.5
-1,561.7 1,576.0 1.68 1.61 4.52

6,188.0 6.70 217.80 5,874.1 -214.3
-1,563.9 1,578.5 0.98 0.97 1.29

6,247.0 6.80 217.80 5,932.7 -219.8
-1,568.2 1,583.4 0.17 0.17 0.00

Projected Survey to TD

Targets

Target Name
- hit/miss target Dip Angle Dip Dir. TVD +NI-S +El-W Northing Easting
- Shape (*) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) Latitude Longitude

MM 31-33 Target 1 0.00 0.00 4,300.0 -203.7
-1,560.5 579,095.40 2,657,579.40 38° 14' 5.865 N 109° 12' 37.799 W

- survey misses target center by 70.7ft at 4613.9ft MD (4302.7 TVD, -155.2 N, -1509.0 E)
- Circle (radius 50.0)

Survey Annotations

Measured Vertical Local Coordinates
Depth Depth +NI-S +El-W

(ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) Comment
6,247.0 5,932.7 -219.8

-1,568.2 Projected Survey to TD

Checked By: Approved By: Date:
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JOB NO.: CA-11580 Report Time: 2400 15 of 15
Company: Patara Oil and Gas API JOB #

LOCATION: Lasal WORK ORDER#
RIG NAME: Frontier # 4 FIELD: LaSal

STATE: Utah Township: 298

COUNTY: sanJuan SECT\RANGE: 31 25E

WELL NAME: Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25

From Monday, August 22, 2011 at 0000 to Monday, August 22, 2011 at 2400
DRILLINGSUMMARY Drilling Parameters

Start Depth 6247.00 Rotary Hours 0.00 WOB 22 Pick UP 165 Slack Off 70 SPM
End Depth 6247.00 Circulating Hours 0.00 RAB 105 SPP 1850 FlowRate 520-520 150
Total Drilled: 0.00 Avg. Total ROP: NA Mud Data
Total Rotary Drilled: 0.00 Avg. Rotary ROP: NA Type K Formate PV 10 SOLID 0.83
Total Drilled Sliding: 0.00 Avg. Slide ROP: NA Weight 8.5 GAS O YP 12 BHT° 118
Slide Hours: 0.00 Percent Rotary: NA Viscosity 42 SAND 0.02 PH 9.5 Flow T 90
Below Rotary Hrs. 1.00 Percent Slide: NA Chlorides 2800 WL 0 Oil % 0

PERSONNEL CASING BHA
Lead Directional : BillyHowell Size Lb/ft Set Depth BHA# 3:7 7/8 FX64D, 1.5 Fixed, 6.25

NMPO A R I IRHO 6 25 NMD 6 94

Second Directional : Joe McIntosh NMDC, 6 - 6" DC, (24) Spiral HWDP,

MWD Operator1 Ryan Mahoney

MWD Operator2
Directional Company: crescentDirectional

Geologist: Signature:

Company Man: Steve Record Daily Cost $9,725.00
Incl. In: 6.7 Azm. In: 217.8 Incl. Out: 6.7 Azm. Out: 217.8 Cummulative Cost: $132,118.75

GENERAL COMMENT

Start End Start End ActivityDate Hours COMMENTTime Time Depth Depth Code
22-Aug-11 00:00 01:00 1.00 6247 6247 POOH POOH
22-Aug-11 01:00 24:00 23.00 6247 6247 Standby Standby
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CEMENT JOB REPORT

CUSTOMER PATARA OIL&GASLLC DATE 16-AUG-11 F.R. # 1001843618 SERV. SUPV· CHASEM MURCHISON

LEASE & WELL NAME LOCATION COUNTY-PARISH-BLOCK
MiddleMesa Federal 31-33-29-25- API43037319070 31-29S-25E San Juan Utah

DISTRICT DRILLING CONTRACTOR RIG # TYPE OF JOB
Gran<Wunction Frontier4 Apsface

SIZE & TYPE OF PLUGS LIST-CSG-HARDWARE PHYSICAL SLURRY PROPERTIES
8-5/8"Top Cem Plug, Nitrile cvr, Phe Float Collar,Al Flap, 8-5/8 - 8rd SACKS SLURRY SLURRY WATER PUMP Bbl Bbl

OF WGT YLD GPS TIME SLURRY MIX
Float Shoe 8-5/8-8rd CEMENT PPG FT3 HR:MIN WATER

MATERIALSFURNISHED BY BJ

Fresh Water 8.4 20

Premium LiteCement 425 11.6 2.81 16.15 212.62 163.46
Type IIIw/ additives 125 14.2 1.47 7.35 32.77 21.88
Water 8.34 162.3

Available Mix Water 800 Bbl. Available Displ. Fluid 560 Bbl· TOTAL | 427.69| 185.35
HOLE TBG-CSG-D.P. COLLAR DEPTHS

SIZE I *(. EXCESS DEPTH SIZE WGT. TYPE DEPTH GRADE SHOE I FLOAT STAGE
8.625 2713 8.625 32 CSG 2700 J-55 2713 2669

LAST CASING PKR-CMT RET-BR PL-LINER PERF. DEPTH TOP CONN WELL FLUID
SIZE I WGT TYPE DEPTH BRAND & TYPE DEPTH TOP BTM SIZE THREAD TYPE WGT.

16 42.05 60 no packer 0 8.625 8RND WATERBASED MU 9

DISPL. VOLUME DISPL. FLUID CAL. PSI CAL. MAXPSI OP. MAX MAXTBG PSI MAXCSG PSI MIX

VOLUME UOM TYPE WGT. BUMP PLUG TO REV. SO. PSI RATED Operator RATED Operator WATER

162.3 BBLS Water 8.34 468 0 0 0 0 3930 3144 rig tank

Circulation Prior to Job
Circulated Well: Rig BJ Circulation Time: Circulation Rate: BPM

MudDensityIn: LBS/GAL MudDensityOut: LBS/GAL PV&YP MudIn: PV &YP Mud Out:

Gas Present: NO YES Units: SolidsPresent at End of Circulation: NO YES

Displacement And Mud Removal
DisplacedBy: Rig BJ Amount Bled BackAfterJob: BBLS
Retums DuringJob: NONE PARTIAL FULL MethodUsed toVerifyRetums:

Cement Retums at Surface: YES NO Were Retums Planned at Surface: NO YES
Pipe Movement: ROTATION RECIPROCATION NONE UNABLEDUETO STUCKPIPE
Centralizers: NO YES Quantity: Type: BOW RIGID
Job Pumped Through: CHOKEMANIFOLD SQUEEZEMANIFOLD MANIFOLD NOMANIFOLD

Plugs
Numberof Attemptsby BJ: Competition: WiperBallsUsed:

¯

NO YES Quantity:
Plug Catcher Used: X NO YES Parabow Used: X NO YES
Was There a Bottom: NO YES Top of Plug: FT Bottomof Plug: FT

Squeezes (Update Original Treatment Report for Primary Job)

BLOCKSQUEEZE SHOE SQUEEZE TOP OF LINERSQUEEZE PLANNED UNPLANNED

LinerPacker: NO YES BondLog: NO YES PSI Applied: Fluid Weight: LBS/GAL

Casing Test (Update Original Treatment Report for Primary Job)

Casing Test Pressure: PSI With LBS/GAL Mud TimeHeld: Hours Minutes

Shoe Test (Update Original Treatment Report for Primary Job)

DepthDrilledout of Shoe: FT Target EMW: LBS/GAL ActualEMW: LBS/GAL
NumberofTimes Tests Conducted: MudWeightWhen Test was Conducted: LBS/GAL

EXPLANATION:TROUBLE SETTING TOOL, RUNNINGCSG, ETC. PRIOR TO CEMENTING:

ReportPriried on: AUG-18-1110:57:51
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Cement Retums at Surface: YES NO Were Retums Planned at Surface: NO YES
Pipe Movement: ROTATION RECIPROCATION NONE UNABLEDUETO STUCKPIPE
Centralizers: NO YES Quantity: Type: BOW RIGID
Job Pumped Through: CHOKEMANIFOLD SQUEEZEMANIFOLD MANIFOLD NOMANIFOLD

Plugs
Numberof Attemptsby BJ: Competition: WiperBallsUsed:

¯

NO YES Quantity:
Plug Catcher Used: X NO YES Parabow Used: X NO YES
Was There a Bottom: NO YES Top of Plug: FT Bottomof Plug: FT

Squeezes (Update Original Treatment Report for Primary Job)

BLOCKSQUEEZE SHOE SQUEEZE TOP OF LINERSQUEEZE PLANNED UNPLANNED

LinerPacker: NO YES BondLog: NO YES PSI Applied: Fluid Weight: LBS/GAL

Casing Test (Update Original Treatment Report for Primary Job)

Casing Test Pressure: PSI With LBS/GAL Mud TimeHeld: Hours Minutes

Shoe Test (Update Original Treatment Report for Primary Job)

DepthDrilledout of Shoe: FT Target EMW: LBS/GAL ActualEMW: LBS/GAL
NumberofTimes Tests Conducted: MudWeightWhen Test was Conducted: LBS/GAL

EXPLANATION:TROUBLE SETTING TOOL, RUNNINGCSG, ETC. PRIOR TO CEMENTING:

ReportPriried on: AUG-18-1110:57:51



CEMENT JOB REPORT

Problems BeforeJob (1.E.RunningCasing, CirculatingWell,ETC)

Problems DuringJob (1.E.Lost Retums, EquipmentFailure, Bulk Delivery, Foaming,ETC)

ProblemsAfterJob (1.E.Gas at Surface, Float EquipmentFailed, ETC)

PRESSUREIRATE DETAIL EXPLANATION

TIME PRESSURE - PSI RATE Bbl. FLUID FLUID SAFETY MEETING: BJ CREW CO. REP.
HR:MIN. PIPE ANNULUS BPM PUMPED TYPE TEST LINES 3740 PSI

CIRCULATINGWELL - RIG BJ
06:00 safty meeting
06:15 leave yard
09:15 arive loc
10:50 spot trucks
11:00 rig up meeting/ rig up
12:00 safty meeting
12:22 3740 psi test
12:26 41 5 20 H20 spacer
12:28 batch up
12:31 281 5.6 50 SLURRY cement 11.6 ppg
12:47 260 6.5 100 SLURRY cement 11.6 ppg
12:55 230 6.5 150 SLURRY cement 11.6 ppg
13:04 241 6.5 200 SLURRY cement 11.6 ppg
13:10 239 5 20 SLURRY tailcement 14.2 ppg
13:14 243 5 38 SLURRY tail cement 14.2 ppg
13:20 drop plug
13:22 76 5 10 H20 displacment
13:39 332 5 100 H20 displacment
13:54 1055 2 162 H20 bump plug 1/2 bbl back

PSI TO TEST BBL.CMT TOTAL PSI SPOT
BUMPED BUMP FLOAT RETURNSI BBL. LEFT ON TOP OUT Service Supervisor Signature:

PLUG PLUG EQUIP. REVERSED PUMPED CSG CEMENT
N 1055 N 44 420 0 N

Report Printedon: AUG18-11
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p BJ Services JobMaster Program Version 3.50L Job Number: 1001843618
Customer: Patara
WeHName: 31-33-29-25

Patara Surface 31-33-29-25
4000 - 20 i , i i i i i i i 10

PSI Test
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2000 10 - 5Bumped Plug
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0 0 i f
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BJ Services Job Start: Tuesday, August 16,
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CEMENT JOB REPORT

CUSTOMER Patara Oil&Gas, LLC DATE 23-AUG-11 F.R. # 1001845398 SERV. SUPV. CHASE M MURCHISON

LEASE& WELL NAME LOCATION COUNTY-PARISH-BLOCK
MIDDLE MESA FEDERAL #31-33-29-25 - API43037: 31-298-25E San Juan Utah

DISTRICT |DRILLING CONTRACTOR RIG # TYPE OF JOB
Gran<! anoction i Frontier 4 ong string

SIZE & TYPE OF PLUGS LIST-CSG-HARDWARE PHYSICAL SLURRY PROPFRTIES
4-1/2"Top Cem Plug, Nitrile cvr, Phe Float Collar,Al Flap, 4-1/2- Brd SACKS SLURRY SLURRY WATER PUMP Bbl Bbl

oF : WGT YLD GPS TIME SLURRY MIX
Float Shoe 4-1/2-8rd CEMENT Pro FT3 HR:MIN WATER

MATERIALSFURNISHEDBYBJ

Surfactant Wash 8.34 10
35:65:6 Type III 497 12.5 2.15 11.36 190.43 134.43
Treated Water 8.4 96.1
MudClean I 8 34 20
Surfactant Wash 8 34 10
Available Mix Water 400 Bbl. Available DispL Fluid 170 Bbl. TOTAL 326.53 134.43

HOLE TBG-CSG-D.P. COLLARDEPTHS
SI2E Í (EXCESS D 817E ! WGT TYPE PEPTH GRADE 800E I FLOAT STAGE

7.875 6232 4.5 11.6 CSG 6500 P-110 6232 6189
LASTCASING PKR-CMTRET-BRPL-LINER PERF. DEPTH TOP CONN WELLFLUID

SIZE \ WGTI TYPE I DEPTH BRAND&TYPE I DEPTH TOP \ STM SIZE ÏTHREAD TYPE WGT,
8.625 32 2700 opacker 0 4.4 8RN WATER BASED M &

DISPL VOLUME DISPL. FLUID CAL. PSI CAL. MAX PSI OP. MAX MAX TBG PSI MAX CSG PSI MIX
WATERVOLUME UOM TYPE WGT. BUMP PLUG TO REV. SO. PSI RATED Operator RATED Operator

96.1 BBLS Treated Water 8.4 1446 0 0 0 0 10690 i 6552 water tank

EXPLANATION:TROUBLESETilNG TOOL,RUNNINGCSG, ETC. PRIORTO CEMENTING:

PRESSUREIRATEDETAIL EXPLANATION

TIME PRESSURE - PSI RATE BbL FLUID FLUID SAPETYMEETING: BJ CREW CO, REP.
HR:MIN• PIPE ANNULUS BPM PUMPEO TYPE TEST LINES 4200 PSI

CIRCULATINGWELL - RIG BJ

09:45 saftymeeting
10:00 leaveyard

17:00 spot trucks
17:15 rig up meeting I rig up
18:10 safty meeting
18:20 stab head
18:39 4200 psi test
18:40 208 3 10 H20 spacer
18:49 250 5 20 H20 mud clean
18:51 251 5 10 H20 spacer
18:58 22 3.5 25 SLURRY cement 12.5 ppg
19:10 176 5 75 SLURRY cement 125 ppå
19 25 220 5 125 SLURRY cement 12.5 ppg
19 40 71 2.8 175 SLURRY cement 12.5 ppg
20 10 75 2.8 200 SLURRY cement 12.5 ppg
20.18 drop plug
20:20 82 5 10 H20 displacment
2027 600 5.5 H20 displacment

1600 96.1 H20 bump plug 1 bol back shut down/ rig

CEMENT JOB REPORT

CUSTOMER Patara Oil&Gas, LLC DATE 23-AUG-11 F.R. # 1001845398 SERV. SUPV. CHASE M MURCHISON
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WATERVOLUME UOM TYPE WGT. BUMP PLUG TO REV. SO. PSI RATED Operator RATED Operator

96.1 BBLS Treated Water 8.4 1446 0 0 0 0 10690 i 6552 water tank

EXPLANATION:TROUBLESETilNG TOOL,RUNNINGCSG, ETC. PRIORTO CEMENTING:

PRESSUREIRATEDETAIL EXPLANATION

TIME PRESSURE - PSI RATE BbL FLUID FLUID SAPETYMEETING: BJ CREW CO, REP.
HR:MIN• PIPE ANNULUS BPM PUMPEO TYPE TEST LINES 4200 PSI

CIRCULATINGWELL - RIG BJ

09:45 saftymeeting
10:00 leaveyard

17:00 spot trucks
17:15 rig up meeting I rig up
18:10 safty meeting
18:20 stab head
18:39 4200 psi test
18:40 208 3 10 H20 spacer
18:49 250 5 20 H20 mud clean
18:51 251 5 10 H20 spacer
18:58 22 3.5 25 SLURRY cement 12.5 ppg
19:10 176 5 75 SLURRY cement 125 ppå
19 25 220 5 125 SLURRY cement 12.5 ppg
19 40 71 2.8 175 SLURRY cement 12.5 ppg
20 10 75 2.8 200 SLURRY cement 12.5 ppg
20.18 drop plug
20:20 82 5 10 H20 displacment
2027 600 5.5 H20 displacment

1600 96.1 H20 bump plug 1 bol back shut down/ rig



Patara Oil & Gas LLC Downhole Well Profile - Well Completion Report
600 17th Street, Suite 1900S
Denver, CO 80202

Well Name: Middle Mesa Federal 31-33-29-25
API/UWI Surface Legal Location Lease Code Field Name State/Province Well Connguration Type
43-037-31907 Sec. 31 T29S R25E UTU84218 Pine Ridge South Utah Deviated
Original KB Elevation (ft) KB-Ground Distance (ft) Spud Date Rig Release Date PBTD (All)(ftKB) Total Depth All (TVD) (ftKB)

6,677.00 14.00 8/9/2 )11 21:30 8/24/2011 00:00 Original Hole - 6,205.0 Original Hole - 5,932.7

Wellbore Pro1ile Wellbore Drilling Summary
I leviai3d - OriginalHole, 10/6/2011 3:37:49 PM Act Top Act Btm Act Top Act Btm

Section Des Size (in) (ftKB) (ftKB) Start Date End Date (TVD)(ftKB) (TVD)(ftKB)

MD D Conductor 16 14.0 60.0 7/19/2011 7/20/2011
(ftK (ftK Inc! DL Surface 12 1/4 60.0 2,715.0 8/10/2011 8/17/2011 2,487.7
B) B) (°) S Vertical schematic (actual)

DL Production 7 7/8 2,715.0 6,247.0 8/18/2011 8/21/2011 2,487.7 5,932.7
0-7

---- Casing Strings
14.9 0.6 .

ask uu. a nu a un 4µ Set Depth

1-1; Conductor Pipe; 16; Csg Des OD (in) Wt/Len (Ib/ft) Grade Set Depth (ftKB) (TVD)(ftKB)

12.000; 14.0-60.0; 46.00 Conductor 16 0.25 Cond 60.0

oo - o.e Surface 8 5/8 32.00 J-55 2,710.0 2,483.1

Production 4 1/2 11.60 N-80 6,232.0 5,917.8

2-1; Casing Joints; 8 5/8; Cement
1,160.1 19963 27.3 a --7.921; 14.0-2,710.0; Conductor Cement, Casing, 7/19/2011 06:00

2,696.00
Est Top Est Btm Est Top Est Btm Amount Yield

Fluid (ftKB) (ftKB) (TVD)(ftKB) (TVD)(ftKB) Class (sacks) (fts/sack) Dens (Ib/gal)
oo 24832 24.5

Lead 14.0 60.0 G 501-1; Tubing; 2 3/8; 1.995;
14.0-5,507.0; 5,493.00 Surface Casing Cement, Casing, 8/16/2011 06:00

49 24676 24,5 .- 4
3-1; Casing Joints; 4 1/2; Est Top Est Btm Est Top Est Btm Amount Yield

-4
-----4.000;

14.0-6,232.0; Fluid (ftKB) (ftKB) (TVD)(ftKB) (TVD)(ftKB) Class (sacks) (fP/sack) Dens (Ib/ga1)
6,218.00 Lead 14.0 2,400.0 2,207.2 Prem Lite 425 2.81 11.60

5,606.9 swa 32 Tail 2,400.0 2,710.0 2,207.2 2,483.1 Type III 100 1.47 14.20

Production Casing Cement, Casing, 8/23/2011 06:00
Est Top Est Btm Est Top Est Btm Amount Yield

6.6070 s2s43 28 -94 & PerfOrated; 5,607.0- Fluid (ftKB) (ftKB) (TVD)(ftKB) (TVD)(ftKB) Class (sacks) (fP|sack) Dens (lb/gal)
5,611.0; 9/10/2011; Frac Lead 1,160.0 6,232.0 1,116.2 5,917.8 Type III 497 2.16 12.50

•---Treated w/65,069# 20/40
sand and N2 foam. Producing Formations

5.610.9 52982 2 9 9/10/2011 Zone Name Wellbore Top Depth (ftKB) Bottom Depth (ftKB) Btm - Top (ftKB)
Honaker Trail 1 Original Hole 4,371.0 5,784.0 1,413.0
Status Date: 9/13/2011 Status: Flowing Fluid Type: Gas

69 64322 32 Perforated; 5,745.0-
Zone Name Wellbore Top Depth (ftKB) Bottom Depth (ftKB) Btm - Top (ftKB)

re6a 0 2F0r/a4c0 La Sal Sandstone Original Hole 5,784.0 6,190.0 406.0
sand and N2 foam. Status Date: 9/13/2011 Status: Flowing Fluid Type: Gas

e.764.9 54512 27 9/10/2011 Perforation & Frac Summary
Date Top (ftKB) Btm (ftKB) Zone Shot Dens... Calculated. .
9/10/2011 5,607.0 5,611.0 Honaker Trail 1, Original Hole 2.0 9

s.n49 sasao 25 Perforated; 5,775.0-
5,779.0; 9/10/2011; Frac Comment

----Treated w/65,069#20/40 Frac Treated w/65,069# 20/40 sand and N2 foam. 9/10/2011
sand and N2 foam. Date Top (ftKB) Btm (ftKB) Zone Shot Dens... Calculated...

s,nas 54ess 24 9/10/2011 9/10/2011 5,745.0 5,764.0 Honaker Trail 1, Original Hole 2.0 39
Comment
Frac Treated w/65,069# 20/40 sand and N2 foam. 9/10/2011

et soon 57 Perforated; 6,116.0 Date Top (ftKB) Btm (ftKB) Zone Shot Dens... Calculated. .
6re1a8ed0, 61830415

2
4c0 9/10/2011 5,775.0 5,779.0 Honaker Trail 1, Original Hole 2.0 9

sand and N2 foam. Comment
mino sana 59 9/10/2011 Frac Treated w/65,069#20/40 sand and N2 foam. 9/10/2011

Date Top (ftKB) Btm (ftKB) Zone Shot Dens... Calculated. .

9/1/2011 6,116.0 6,128.0 La Sal Sandstone, Original Hole 2.0 25
e,1aos sand 60 - POffOrated; 6,131.0- Comment

6,135.0; 9/1/2011; Frac Frac treated w/68,345#20/40 sand and N2 foam. 9/10/2011
---Treated w/68,345# 20/40 Date Top (ftKB) Btm (ftKB) Zone Shot Dens... Calculated.

suas se292 ao
sandnand N2foam. 9/1/2011 6,131.0 6,135.0 La Sal Sandstone, Original Hole 2.0 9

Comment
Frac Treated wl68,345# 20/40 sand and N2 foam. 9/10/2011

e.isis sese2 63 - PerfOrated; 6,152.0- Date Top (ftKB) Btm (ftKB) Zone Shot Dens... Calculated.
6,158,0; 9/1/2011; Frac 9/1/2011 6,152.0 6,158.0 La Sal Sandstone, Original Hole 2.0 13

---Treated w/68,345# 20/40 Comment
sand and N2 foam- Frac Treated w/68,345#20/40 sand and N2 foam. 9/10/2011

6.1581 sosta 64 9/10/2011
Tubing Strings
Tubing Description Run Date String Length (ft) Set Depth (ftKB)
Tubing - Production 9/20/2011 5,493.00 5,507.0

6,2051 senso 67 |||||E
ltem Des Jts Make Model OD (in) Wt (Ib/ft) Grade Len (ft)

Tubing T&C Upset 2 3/8 4.70 J-55 5,493.00

«222. so,,, as Production Volumes Test Date
Start Date: 9/12/2011 End Date: 9/13/2011
Gas Volume Over Test Date

6.240 sonr 68 PrOduct Type: Reservoir Gas Volume (MCF): 700.000
Liquid Volumes Over Test Date
Production Type: Oil Volume (bbl): 79.0

Dire tiot al Profilt : "my.Water Volume (bbl): 34.0

Ileviaied - OriginalHole, 10/6/2011 3:37:49 PM I Gdo rau ity

Directional schematic (actual) ummanL 0.714
API Ull Gravity
Comment: .55

Date of First Sales
on ornanction rato· 9/13/2011

Perforated; 5,607.0-5,611.0; 9/10/2011
Perforated; 5,745.0-5,764.0; 9/10/2011
Perforated; 5,775.0-5,779.0; 9/10/2011
Perforated; 6,116.0-6,128.0; 9/1/2011
Perforated; 6,131.0-6,135.0; 9/1/2011
Perforated; 6,152.0-6,158.0; 9/1/2011

www.peloton.com Page 1/1 Report Printed:

Patara Oil & Gas LLC Downhole Well Profile - Well Completion Report
600 17th Street, Suite 1900S
Denver, CO 80202
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API/UWI Surface Legal Location Lease Code Field Name State/Province Well Connguration Type
43-037-31907 Sec. 31 T29S R25E UTU84218 Pine Ridge South Utah Deviated
Original KB Elevation (ft) KB-Ground Distance (ft) Spud Date Rig Release Date PBTD (All)(ftKB) Total Depth All (TVD) (ftKB)

6,677.00 14.00 8/9/2 )11 21:30 8/24/2011 00:00 Original Hole - 6,205.0 Original Hole - 5,932.7

Wellbore Pro1ile Wellbore Drilling Summary
I leviai3d - OriginalHole, 10/6/2011 3:37:49 PM Act Top Act Btm Act Top Act Btm

Section Des Size (in) (ftKB) (ftKB) Start Date End Date (TVD)(ftKB) (TVD)(ftKB)

MD D Conductor 16 14.0 60.0 7/19/2011 7/20/2011
(ftK (ftK Inc! DL Surface 12 1/4 60.0 2,715.0 8/10/2011 8/17/2011 2,487.7
B) B) (°) S Vertical schematic (actual)

DL Production 7 7/8 2,715.0 6,247.0 8/18/2011 8/21/2011 2,487.7 5,932.7
0-7

---- Casing Strings
14.9 0.6 .

ask uu. a nu a un 4µ Set Depth

1-1; Conductor Pipe; 16; Csg Des OD (in) Wt/Len (Ib/ft) Grade Set Depth (ftKB) (TVD)(ftKB)

12.000; 14.0-60.0; 46.00 Conductor 16 0.25 Cond 60.0
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Production 4 1/2 11.60 N-80 6,232.0 5,917.8
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1,160.1 19963 27.3

a --7.921; 14.0-2,710.0; Conductor Cement, Casing, 7/19/2011 06:00
2,696.00

Est Top Est Btm Est Top Est Btm Amount Yield
Fluid (ftKB) (ftKB) (TVD)(ftKB) (TVD)(ftKB) Class (sacks) (fts/sack) Dens (Ib/gal)
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3-1; Casing Joints; 4 1/2; Est Top Est Btm Est Top Est Btm Amount Yield
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6,135.0; 9/1/2011; Frac Frac treated w/68,345#20/40 sand and N2 foam. 9/10/2011
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Tubing Strings
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Tubing T&C Upset 2 3/8 4.70 J-55 5,493.00

«222. so,,, as Production Volumes Test Date
Start Date: 9/12/2011 End Date: 9/13/2011
Gas Volume Over Test Date

6.240 sonr 68 PrOduct Type: Reservoir Gas Volume (MCF): 700.000
Liquid Volumes Over Test Date
Production Type: Oil Volume (bbl): 79.0

Dire tiot al Profilt : "my.Water Volume (bbl): 34.0

Ileviaied - OriginalHole, 10/6/2011 3:37:49 PM I Gdo rau ity

Directional schematic (actual) ummanL 0.714
API Ull Gravity
Comment: .55

Date of First Sales
on ornanction rato· 9/13/2011

Perforated; 5,607.0-5,611.0; 9/10/2011
Perforated; 5,745.0-5,764.0; 9/10/2011
Perforated; 5,775.0-5,779.0; 9/10/2011
Perforated; 6,116.0-6,128.0; 9/1/2011
Perforated; 6,131.0-6,135.0; 9/1/2011
Perforated; 6,152.0-6,158.0; 9/1/2011
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STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-76335 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 MIDDLE MESA 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC

9. API NUMBER:
 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 600 17th Street Ste 1900S , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 SOUTH PINE RIDGE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1873 FSL 1795 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.0S Range: 25.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 SAN JUAN 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

12/6/2011

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: Site security

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Patara Oil & Gas has completed the placement of surface production
equipment on the subject well, and the well is now, and/or has been,

producing a continuous flow of hydrocarbons. Clean produced water is being
hauled via truck to the disposal well located at Patara’s Lisbon Gas Plant in La

Sal, UT. Dirty produced water is being hauled via truck to the Ream’s
Construction 80 Ponds Treatment and Recycling Facility located in Naturita,

CO. Any produced oil from the well is trucked off lease to a sales point and is
sold to market. Please retain the attached site security diagrams and water
haul maps for your records. Please contact Christopher Noonan with Patara

with any questions or concerns.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Christopher Noonan 303 563-5377

TITLE
 Production Technician

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 12/6/2011

12/08/2011

Dec. 06, 2011

Sundry Number: 21072 API Well Number: 43037319070000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAS7E6DE55IGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. MIDDLE MESA

1.TYPE OF VVELL 8.VVELLNAMEand NUMBER:
Gas Viell MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street Ste 1900S , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685 E×t SOUTH PINE RIDGE

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SAN JUAN

1873 FSL 1795 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.05 Range: 25.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

12/6/2011 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINRLRErt
D e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Site security

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Patara Oil & Gas has completed the placement of surface production
equipment on the subject well, and the well is now, and/or has been,

producing a continuous flow of hydrocarbons. Clean produced water is beingccepted by the
hauled via truck to the disposal well located at Patara's Lisbon Gas Plant in LWtah Division of

Sal, UT. Dirty produced water is being hauled via truck to the Ream's Oil, Gas and Mining
Construction 80 Ponds Treatment and Recycling Facility located in NaFOR RECORD ONLYCO. Any produced oil from the well is trucked off lease to a sales point and is

sold to market. Please retain the attached site security diagrams and water
haul maps for your records. Please contact Christopher Noonan with Patara

with any questions or concerns.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Christopher Noonan 303 563-5377 Production Technician

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAS7E6DE55IGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. MIDDLE MESA

1.TYPE OF VVELL 8.VVELLNAMEand NUMBER:
Gas Viell MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street Ste 1900S , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685 E×t SOUTH PINE RIDGE

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SAN JUAN

1873 FSL 1795 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.05 Range: 25.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

12/6/2011 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINRLRErt
D e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Site security

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Patara Oil & Gas has completed the placement of surface production
equipment on the subject well, and the well is now, and/or has been,

producing a continuous flow of hydrocarbons. Clean produced water is beingccepted by the
hauled via truck to the disposal well located at Patara's Lisbon Gas Plant in LWtah Division of

Sal, UT. Dirty produced water is being hauled via truck to the Ream's Oil, Gas and Mining
Construction 80 Ponds Treatment and Recycling Facility located in NaFOR RECORD ONLYCO. Any produced oil from the well is trucked off lease to a sales point and is

sold to market. Please retain the attached site security diagrams and water
haul maps for your records. Please contact Christopher Noonan with Patara

with any questions or concerns.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Christopher Noonan 303 563-5377 Production Technician

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



THIS LEASE IS SUBJECT TO THE SITE SECURITY PLAN.

THE PLAN IS LOCATED AT:

Patara Oil and Gas USA, Inc.

Lisbon Plant

7 Rankine Road

La Sal, Utah 84530

GENERAL SEALING OF VALVES, SALES BY TANK GAUGING

 All drain valves, D1 & D2, and sales valves, S1 & S2, will be sealed closed during production.

D3 will be closed, but not sealed.

Drain valves D1 & D2, and fill valves F1 & F2, will be sealed closed during sales. D3 will be closed,

but not sealed. The sales valves S1 & S2, will be closed and re-sealed after completion of sales activities.

Sales valves, S1 & S2, will be sealed closed during draining. The drain

valves D1 & D2 will be closed and re-sealed after completion of draining activities. D3 will be closed after

completion of draining activities, but not sealed.

Drain valves, D1 & D2, will be sealed closed during draining. D3 will be

closed, but not sealed. The sales valves S1 & S2 will be closed and re-sealed after completion of draining

activities.

Site diagram and plan are available during normal working hours.

NOTE:

1. DRAWING IS NOT TO SCALE

2. ACTUAL PHYSICAL LOCATION OF UNDERGROUND FLOW

  LINES MAY NOT BE ACCURATELY REPRESENTED ON THIS

  DRAWING. MAKE ONE CALL AND USE PIPE LOCATOR

  PRIOR TO DIGGING.

Dec. 06, 2011

Sundry Number: 21072 API Well Number: 43037319070000
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Bull Horn Fed 15‐13‐30‐25

Patara Lisbon Gas Plant & 
Water Disposal Well

2010 & 2011 New Drill Wells
PRODUCED WATER HAUL ROUTE

Patara Oil & Gas LLC
Bull Horn Fed 15‐13‐30‐25

Middle Mesa Fed 26‐34‐29‐24
Middle Mesa Fed 25‐31‐29‐24
Middle Mesa Fed 25‐41‐29‐24
Middle Mesa Fed 31‐33‐29‐25
Middle Mesa Fed 4‐20‐29‐25
Middle Mesa Fed 31‐44‐29‐25

San Juan County, Utah

LEGEND

Drafted by Patara Oil & Gas LLC

Clean Produced Water

Middle Mesa Fed 26‐34‐29‐24
Middle Mesa Fed 25‐31‐29‐24

Middle Mesa Fed 25‐41‐29‐24

Middle Mesa Fed 31‐33‐29‐25

Middle Mesa Fed 31‐44‐29‐25

Middle Mesa Fed 4‐20‐29‐25

Patara Oil & Gas LLC

Dec. 06, 2011

Sundry Number: 21072 API Well Number: 43037319070000
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Bull Horn Fed 15‐13‐30‐25

Patara Lisbon Gas Plant & 
Water Disposal Well

2010 & 2011 New Drill Wells
PRODUCED WATER HAUL ROUTE

Patara Oil & Gas LLC
Bull Horn Fed 15‐13‐30‐25

Middle Mesa Fed 26‐34‐29‐24
Middle Mesa Fed 25‐31‐29‐24
Middle Mesa Fed 25‐41‐29‐24
Middle Mesa Fed 31‐33‐29‐25
Middle Mesa Fed 4‐20‐29‐25
Middle Mesa Fed 31‐44‐29‐25

San Juan County, Utah

LEGEND

Drafted by Patara Oil & Gas LLC

Dirty Produced Water

Middle Mesa Fed 26‐34‐29‐24
Middle Mesa Fed 25‐31‐29‐24
Middle Mesa Fed 25‐41‐29‐24
Middle Mesa Fed 31‐33‐29‐25
Middle Mesa Fed 31‐44‐29‐25

Middle Mesa Fed 4‐20‐29‐25

Hi
gh
w
ay
 1
91

Highway 46

Patara Oil & Gas LLC

Reams Construction 80 
Ponds Treatment & 
Recycling Facility

Highway 141

Dec. 06, 2011

Sundry Number: 21072 API Well Number: 43037319070000

Middle Mesa Fed 26-34-29-24
Middle Mesa Fed 25-31-29-24
Middle Mesa Fed 25-41-29-24
Middle Mesa Fed 31-33-29-25
Middle Mesa Fed 31-44-29-25
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2010 & 2011 New Drill Wells
. PRODUCEDWATER HAULROUTE
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STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-76335 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 MIDDLE MESA 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC

9. API NUMBER:
 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 600 17th Street Ste 1900S , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 SOUTH PINE RIDGE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1873 FSL 1795 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.0S Range: 25.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 SAN JUAN 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

12/6/2011

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: Site security

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Patara Oil & Gas has completed the placement of surface production
equipment on the subject well, and the well is now, and/or has been,

producing a continuous flow of hydrocarbons. Clean produced water is being
hauled via truck to the disposal well located at Patara’s Lisbon Gas Plant in La

Sal, UT. Dirty produced water is being hauled via truck to the Ream’s
Construction 80 Ponds Treatment and Recycling Facility located in Naturita,

CO. Any produced oil from the well is trucked off lease to a sales point and is
sold to market. Please retain the attached site security diagrams and water
haul maps for your records. Please contact Christopher Noonan with Patara

with any questions or concerns.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Christopher Noonan 303 563-5377

TITLE
 Production Technician

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 12/6/2011

12/08/2011

Dec. 06, 2011

Sundry Number: 21072 API Well Number: 43037319070000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAS7E6DE55IGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. MIDDLE MESA

1.TYPE OF VVELL 8.VVELLNAMEand NUMBER:
Gas Viell MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street Ste 1900S , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685 E×t SOUTH PINE RIDGE

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SAN JUAN

1873 FSL 1795 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.05 Range: 25.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

12/6/2011 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINRLRErt
D e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Site security

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Patara Oil & Gas has completed the placement of surface production
equipment on the subject well, and the well is now, and/or has been,

producing a continuous flow of hydrocarbons. Clean produced water is beingccepted by the
hauled via truck to the disposal well located at Patara's Lisbon Gas Plant in LWtah Division of

Sal, UT. Dirty produced water is being hauled via truck to the Ream's Oil, Gas and Mining
Construction 80 Ponds Treatment and Recycling Facility located in NaFOR RECORD ONLYCO. Any produced oil from the well is trucked off lease to a sales point and is

sold to market. Please retain the attached site security diagrams and water
haul maps for your records. Please contact Christopher Noonan with Patara

with any questions or concerns.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Christopher Noonan 303 563-5377 Production Technician

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAS7E6DE55IGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. MIDDLE MESA

1.TYPE OF VVELL 8.VVELLNAMEand NUMBER:
Gas Viell MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street Ste 1900S , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685 E×t SOUTH PINE RIDGE

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SAN JUAN

1873 FSL 1795 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.05 Range: 25.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

12/6/2011 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINRLRErt
D e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Site security

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Patara Oil & Gas has completed the placement of surface production
equipment on the subject well, and the well is now, and/or has been,

producing a continuous flow of hydrocarbons. Clean produced water is beingccepted by the
hauled via truck to the disposal well located at Patara's Lisbon Gas Plant in LWtah Division of

Sal, UT. Dirty produced water is being hauled via truck to the Ream's Oil, Gas and Mining
Construction 80 Ponds Treatment and Recycling Facility located in NaFOR RECORD ONLYCO. Any produced oil from the well is trucked off lease to a sales point and is

sold to market. Please retain the attached site security diagrams and water
haul maps for your records. Please contact Christopher Noonan with Patara

with any questions or concerns.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Christopher Noonan 303 563-5377 Production Technician

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



THIS LEASE IS SUBJECT TO THE SITE SECURITY PLAN.

THE PLAN IS LOCATED AT:

Patara Oil and Gas USA, Inc.

Lisbon Plant

7 Rankine Road

La Sal, Utah 84530

GENERAL SEALING OF VALVES, SALES BY TANK GAUGING

 All drain valves, D1 & D2, and sales valves, S1 & S2, will be sealed closed during production.

D3 will be closed, but not sealed.

Drain valves D1 & D2, and fill valves F1 & F2, will be sealed closed during sales. D3 will be closed,

but not sealed. The sales valves S1 & S2, will be closed and re-sealed after completion of sales activities.

Sales valves, S1 & S2, will be sealed closed during draining. The drain

valves D1 & D2 will be closed and re-sealed after completion of draining activities. D3 will be closed after

completion of draining activities, but not sealed.

Drain valves, D1 & D2, will be sealed closed during draining. D3 will be

closed, but not sealed. The sales valves S1 & S2 will be closed and re-sealed after completion of draining

activities.

Site diagram and plan are available during normal working hours.

NOTE:

1. DRAWING IS NOT TO SCALE

2. ACTUAL PHYSICAL LOCATION OF UNDERGROUND FLOW

  LINES MAY NOT BE ACCURATELY REPRESENTED ON THIS

  DRAWING. MAKE ONE CALL AND USE PIPE LOCATOR

  PRIOR TO DIGGING.

Dec. 06, 2011

Sundry Number: 21072 API Well Number: 43037319070000
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STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-76335 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 MIDDLE MESA 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC

9. API NUMBER:
 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 600 17th Street Ste 1900S , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 SOUTH PINE RIDGE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1873 FSL 1795 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.0S Range: 25.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 SAN JUAN 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

12/6/2011

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: Site security

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Patara Oil & Gas has completed the placement of surface production
equipment on the subject well, and the well is now, and/or has been,

producing a continuous flow of hydrocarbons. Clean produced water is being
hauled via truck to the disposal well located at Patara’s Lisbon Gas Plant in La

Sal, UT. Dirty produced water is being hauled via truck to the Ream’s
Construction 80 Ponds Treatment and Recycling Facility located in Naturita,

CO. Any produced oil from the well is trucked off lease to a sales point and is
sold to market. Please retain the attached site security diagrams and water
haul maps for your records. Please contact Christopher Noonan with Patara

with any questions or concerns.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Christopher Noonan 303 563-5377

TITLE
 Production Technician

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 12/6/2011

12/08/2011

Dec. 06, 2011

Sundry Number: 21072 API Well Number: 43037319070000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAS7E6DE55IGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. MIDDLE MESA

1.TYPE OF VVELL 8.VVELLNAMEand NUMBER:
Gas Viell MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street Ste 1900S , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685 E×t SOUTH PINE RIDGE

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SAN JUAN

1873 FSL 1795 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.05 Range: 25.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

12/6/2011 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINRLRErt
D e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Site security

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Patara Oil & Gas has completed the placement of surface production
equipment on the subject well, and the well is now, and/or has been,

producing a continuous flow of hydrocarbons. Clean produced water is beingccepted by the
hauled via truck to the disposal well located at Patara's Lisbon Gas Plant in LWtah Division of

Sal, UT. Dirty produced water is being hauled via truck to the Ream's Oil, Gas and Mining
Construction 80 Ponds Treatment and Recycling Facility located in NaFOR RECORD ONLYCO. Any produced oil from the well is trucked off lease to a sales point and is

sold to market. Please retain the attached site security diagrams and water
haul maps for your records. Please contact Christopher Noonan with Patara

with any questions or concerns.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Christopher Noonan 303 563-5377 Production Technician

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAS7E6DE55IGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. MIDDLE MESA

1.TYPE OF VVELL 8.VVELLNAMEand NUMBER:
Gas Viell MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
PATARA OIL & GAS, LLC 43037319070000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street Ste 1900S , Denver, CO, 80202 303 825-0685 E×t SOUTH PINE RIDGE

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: SAN JUAN

1873 FSL 1795 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 31 Township: 29.05 Range: 25.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

12/6/2011 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINRLRErt
D e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Site security

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Patara Oil & Gas has completed the placement of surface production
equipment on the subject well, and the well is now, and/or has been,

producing a continuous flow of hydrocarbons. Clean produced water is beingccepted by the
hauled via truck to the disposal well located at Patara's Lisbon Gas Plant in LWtah Division of

Sal, UT. Dirty produced water is being hauled via truck to the Ream's Oil, Gas and Mining
Construction 80 Ponds Treatment and Recycling Facility located in NaFOR RECORD ONLYCO. Any produced oil from the well is trucked off lease to a sales point and is

sold to market. Please retain the attached site security diagrams and water
haul maps for your records. Please contact Christopher Noonan with Patara

with any questions or concerns.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Christopher Noonan 303 563-5377 Production Technician

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



THIS LEASE IS SUBJECT TO THE SITE SECURITY PLAN.

THE PLAN IS LOCATED AT:

Patara Oil and Gas USA, Inc.

Lisbon Plant

7 Rankine Road

La Sal, Utah 84530

GENERAL SEALING OF VALVES, SALES BY TANK GAUGING

 All drain valves, D1 & D2, and sales valves, S1 & S2, will be sealed closed during production.

D3 will be closed, but not sealed.

Drain valves D1 & D2, and fill valves F1 & F2, will be sealed closed during sales. D3 will be closed,

but not sealed. The sales valves S1 & S2, will be closed and re-sealed after completion of sales activities.

Sales valves, S1 & S2, will be sealed closed during draining. The drain

valves D1 & D2 will be closed and re-sealed after completion of draining activities. D3 will be closed after

completion of draining activities, but not sealed.

Drain valves, D1 & D2, will be sealed closed during draining. D3 will be

closed, but not sealed. The sales valves S1 & S2 will be closed and re-sealed after completion of draining

activities.

Site diagram and plan are available during normal working hours.

NOTE:

1. DRAWING IS NOT TO SCALE

2. ACTUAL PHYSICAL LOCATION OF UNDERGROUND FLOW

  LINES MAY NOT BE ACCURATELY REPRESENTED ON THIS

  DRAWING. MAKE ONE CALL AND USE PIPE LOCATOR

  PRIOR TO DIGGING.

Dec. 06, 2011

Sundry Number: 21072 API Well Number: 43037319070000
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 11/1/2012

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N3670- Patara Oil & Gas, LLC N3645- CCI Paradox Upstream, LLC
600 17th Street, Suite 1900S 600 17th Street, Suite 1900S
Denver, CO 80202 Denver, CO 80202

Phone: 1 (303) 825-0685 Phone: 1 (303) 825-0685

CA No. Unit: Middle Mesa
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL

NO TYPE TYPE STATUS
See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 1/23/2013
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 2/7/2013
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 2/12/2013
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 8523441-0161
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Not Yet
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: N/A
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 2/12/2013
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM Not Yet BIA N/A
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: Not Yet
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 2/12/2013
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 2/12/2013
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 2/7/2013
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 2/12/2013
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: N/A
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: 2/4/2013
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 105865919
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 105865922
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: N/A
COMMENTS:

CCI Paradox Upstream, LLC (N3945).xls

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 11/1/2012

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N3670- Patara Oil & Gas, LLC N3645- CCI Paradox Upstream, LLC
600 17th Street, Suite 1900S 600 17th Street, Suite 1900S
Denver, CO 80202 Denver, CO 80202

Phone: 1 (303) 825-0685 Phone: 1 (303) 825-0685

CA No. Unit: Middle Mesa
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL

NO TYPE TYPE STATUS
See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 1/23/2013
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 2/7/2013
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 2/12/2013
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 8523441-0161
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Not Yet
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: N/A
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 2/12/2013
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM Not Yet BIA N/A
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: Not Yet
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 2/12/2013
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 2/12/2013
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 2/7/2013
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 2/12/2013
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: N/A
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: 2/4/2013
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 105865919
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 105865922
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: N/A
COMMENTS:

CCI Paradox Upstream, LLC (N3945).xls



Patara Oil Gas, LLC (N3670) to CCI Paradox Upstream, LLC(N3945
Effective 11/1/2012
Middle Mesa Unit

Lease Well Well
Well Name Section TWN RNG API Number Entity Type Type Status
MIDDLE MESA FED 30-41-29-25 30 290S 250E 4303731893 Federal GW APD
MIDDLE MESA FED 25-43-29-24 25 290S 240E 4303731901 Federal GW APD
MIDDLE MESA FED 26-23-29À426 290S 240E 4303731905 Federal GW APD
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-22-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731909 Federal GW APD
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-11-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731910 Federal GW APD
Middle Mesa Fed 31-42-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303750021 Federal GW APD
Middle Mesa Federal 5-8-30-25 05 300S 250E 4303750026 Federal GW APD
BIG INDIAN 35-24 35 290S 240E 4303731829 14409 Federal GW P
MIDDLE MESA ST 36-14-29-24 36 290S 240E 4303731838 15076 State GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 5-6-30-25 05 300S 250E 4303731853 16375 Federal GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-31-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731854 15076 Federal GW P
MIDDLE MESA ST 36-12-29-24 36 290S 240E 4303731855 15076 State GW P
MIDDLE MESA ST 36-24-29-24 36 290S 240E 4303731856 15076 State GW P
MIDDLE MESA ST 36-12B-29-24 36 290S 240E 4303731877 15076 State GW P
MIDDLE MESA ST 36-248-29-24 36 290S 240E 4303731878 15076 State GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 5-10-30-25 05 300S 250E 4303731897 18802 Federal GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 25-41-29-24 25 290S 240E 4303731902 17717 Federal GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 25-31-29-24 25 290S 240E 4303731903 18159 Federal GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 26-34-29-24 26 290S 240E 4303731904 18118 Federal GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-44-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731906 18213 Federal GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731907 18170 Federal GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 4-20-30-25 04 300S 250E 4303750010 18193 Federal GW

Patara Oil Gas, LLC (N3670) to CCI Paradox Upstream, LLC(N3945
Effective 11/1/2012
Middle Mesa Unit

Lease Well Well
Well Name Section TWN RNG API Number Entity Type Type Status
MIDDLE MESA FED 30-41-29-25 30 290S 250E 4303731893 Federal GW APD
MIDDLE MESA FED 25-43-29-24 25 290S 240E 4303731901 Federal GW APD
MIDDLE MESA FED 26-23-29À426 290S 240E 4303731905 Federal GW APD
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-22-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731909 Federal GW APD
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-11-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731910 Federal GW APD
Middle Mesa Fed 31-42-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303750021 Federal GW APD
Middle Mesa Federal 5-8-30-25 05 300S 250E 4303750026 Federal GW APD
BIG INDIAN 35-24 35 290S 240E 4303731829 14409 Federal GW P
MIDDLE MESA ST 36-14-29-24 36 290S 240E 4303731838 15076 State GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 5-6-30-25 05 300S 250E 4303731853 16375 Federal GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-31-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731854 15076 Federal GW P
MIDDLE MESA ST 36-12-29-24 36 290S 240E 4303731855 15076 State GW P
MIDDLE MESA ST 36-24-29-24 36 290S 240E 4303731856 15076 State GW P
MIDDLE MESA ST 36-12B-29-24 36 290S 240E 4303731877 15076 State GW P
MIDDLE MESA ST 36-248-29-24 36 290S 240E 4303731878 15076 State GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 5-10-30-25 05 300S 250E 4303731897 18802 Federal GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 25-41-29-24 25 290S 240E 4303731902 17717 Federal GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 25-31-29-24 25 290S 240E 4303731903 18159 Federal GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 26-34-29-24 26 290S 240E 4303731904 18118 Federal GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-44-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731906 18213 Federal GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731907 18170 Federal GW P
MIDDLE MESA FED 4-20-30-25 04 300S 250E 4303750010 18193 Federal GW



RECBVED
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MININGDIV.0FOILGAS&WNING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

n/a
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS nia
7. UNITorCA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not usé thisform for proposals to drillnewwells,significantly deepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1.TYPEOFWELL

OILWELL O GASWELL OTHER MultipleWellTransfer 8 WE NAeMEandNUMBER:

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Patara Oil & Gas LLc NAL O nia

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
600 17th St. Ste. 1900S on Denver

STATE CO 7,80202 (303) 825-0685 n/a
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: O/S COUNTY: $2tnÀUan, UT

QTR/QTR,SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEiN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:11/1/2012 O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Patara Oil & Gas LLC (Patara) hereby requests the transfer of operating rights and responsibilities for the subject wells, listed
herein, to the new ownerloperator of the assets, being effective November 1, 2012; CCI Paradox Upstream LLC (CCI).

Please see Exhibit I for a detailed list of upstream assets considered for transfer.Patara midstream assets willbe transferred
via a separate letter, enclosed.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) Christopher A. Noonan TITLE Regulations & Production Reporting Supervisor

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only) APPROVED
FEB12 2013

(5/2000)
. Ca.. GAS&MINING

RECBVED
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MININGDIV.0FOILGAS&WNING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

n/a
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS nia
7. UNITorCA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not usé thisform for proposals to drillnewwells,significantly deepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1.TYPEOFWELL

OILWELL O GASWELL OTHER MultipleWellTransfer 8 WE NAeMEandNUMBER:

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Patara Oil & Gas LLc NAL O nia

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
600 17th St. Ste. 1900S on Denver

STATE CO 7,80202 (303) 825-0685 n/a
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: O/S COUNTY: $2tnÀUan, UT

QTR/QTR,SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEiN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:11/1/2012 O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Patara Oil & Gas LLC (Patara) hereby requests the transfer of operating rights and responsibilities for the subject wells, listed
herein, to the new ownerloperator of the assets, being effective November 1, 2012; CCI Paradox Upstream LLC (CCI).

Please see Exhibit I for a detailed list of upstream assets considered for transfer.Patara midstream assets willbe transferred
via a separate letter, enclosed.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) Christopher A. Noonan TITLE Regulations & Production Reporting Supervisor

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only) APPROVED
FEB12 2013

(5/2000)
. Ca.. GAS&MINING



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS ANDMINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER

n/a
6. IF INDIAN.ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAME:SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS n/a
7. UNITor CAAGREEMENTNAME:Do not use thisform for proposalsto drillnew wells, significantlydeepen exlstingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TOORILL forn for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL

OIL WELL GAS WELL Ü OTHER MultipleWellTransfer 8 NWE and NUMBER

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR 9. APINUMBER:
CCI Paradox Upstream LLC n/a

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELDANDPOOL,OR WILDCAT:
600 17th St. Ste. 1900S on Denver

STATE CO z,,80202 (303) 825-0685 n/a
4. LOCATlÓNOF WELL

FOOTAGES ATSURFACE: /8 COUNTY San juan,UT
QTR/QTR, SECTION,TOWNSHIP,RANGE,MERIDIAN: STATE

UTAH

9t CHECKAPPROPRIATEBOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE,REPORT, OR OTHERDATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ^CIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATECURRENTFORMATIONO NOTICEOF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTOREPAIRWELL

Approximate date work willstart CASINGREPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATORCHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

2 SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUGBACK WATERDISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGEWEt.LSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) O WATERSHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion-

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSm¯
OTHER11/1/2012 O CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE- DIFFERENTFORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details includingdates, depths, volumes, etc.

CCI Paradox Upstream LLC(CCI), hereby requests thetransferof operating rights and responsibilities for the subject wells,
listed herein, to the new ownerloperator of the assets, CCI, being effective November 1, 2012. The assets were previously
operated by Patara Oil &Gas LLC(Patara) prior to sale.

Please see Exhibiti for a detailed list of upstream assets considered for transfer.Patara midstream assets willbe transferred
via a separate letter, enclosed.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) Chri opher A. Noonan ulations & Production Reporting Supervisor

SIGNATURE DATE 2/6/2012

(This space for State use only)

RECE IVEDAPPROVED
.

FEBO7 2013
FEBi 2 2013(5/2000) (See Instructionson Reverse Side)

Div.ofOitGas &WliningDIV.OlLGAS&

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS ANDMINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER

n/a
6. IF INDIAN.ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAME:SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS n/a
7. UNITor CAAGREEMENTNAME:Do not use thisform for proposalsto drillnew wells, significantlydeepen exlstingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TOORILL forn for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL

OIL WELL GAS WELL Ü OTHER MultipleWellTransfer 8 NWE and NUMBER

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR 9. APINUMBER:
CCI Paradox Upstream LLC n/a

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELDANDPOOL,OR WILDCAT:
600 17th St. Ste. 1900S on Denver

STATE CO z,,80202 (303) 825-0685 n/a
4. LOCATlÓNOF WELL

FOOTAGES ATSURFACE: /8 COUNTY San juan,UT
QTR/QTR, SECTION,TOWNSHIP,RANGE,MERIDIAN: STATE

UTAH

9t CHECKAPPROPRIATEBOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE,REPORT, OR OTHERDATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ^CIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATECURRENTFORMATIONO NOTICEOF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTOREPAIRWELL

Approximate date work willstart CASINGREPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATORCHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

2 SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUGBACK WATERDISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGEWEt.LSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) O WATERSHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion-

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSm¯
OTHER11/1/2012 O CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE- DIFFERENTFORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details includingdates, depths, volumes, etc.

CCI Paradox Upstream LLC(CCI), hereby requests thetransferof operating rights and responsibilities for the subject wells,
listed herein, to the new ownerloperator of the assets, CCI, being effective November 1, 2012. The assets were previously
operated by Patara Oil &Gas LLC(Patara) prior to sale.

Please see Exhibiti for a detailed list of upstream assets considered for transfer.Patara midstream assets willbe transferred
via a separate letter, enclosed.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) Chri opher A. Noonan ulations & Production Reporting Supervisor

SIGNATURE DATE 2/6/2012

(This space for State use only)

RECE IVEDAPPROVED
.

FEBO7 2013
FEBi 2 2013(5/2000) (See Instructionson Reverse Side)

Div.ofOitGas &WliningDIV.OlLGAS&



Exhibit l

BLMForm 3160-5 Transfer of Operator
Utah Form 9 Transfer of Operator

State of Utah Upstream Assets

01/09/2013

Well Township-
API Well Number Operator Well Name Well Status Type Field Name County Qtr/Qtr Section Range)

PATARAOIL
43-037-15049-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBOND-616 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NENE 16 305-24E 9

PATARAOIL
43-037-15123-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONB-615 Producing Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NENW 15 305-24E 7

PATARAOlL
43-037-15769-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONB912 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN SESW 12 305-24E

PATARAOIL
43-037-16219-00-00 & GAS LLC BIG INDIANUNIT1 Shut-In Oil Well BIG INDIAN(MADISON) SANJUAN SENE 33 295-24E

PATARAOIL Gas
43-037-16221-00-00 & GAS LLC BIG INDIAN4 Shut-In Well BIG INDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN SWSW 14 305-25E

Water
PATARAOIL Disposal

43-037-16237-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONA-715 Inactive Well LISBON SANJUAN SWNW 15 305-24E
PATARAOIL

43-037-16240-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONB-613 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NENW 13 305-24E
PATARAOIL

43-037-16242-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONB-616 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NESW 16 305-24E
Water

PATARAOIL BELCOST 4 Disposal 1
43-037-16244-00-00 & GAS LLC (LISBONB-816) Active Well LISBON SANJUAN NESW 16 305-24E

PATARAOIL ge
43-037-16245-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONC-69 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NWNE 9

Exhibit l

BLMForm 3160-5 Transfer of Operator
Utah Form 9 Transfer of Operator

State of Utah Upstream Assets

01/09/2013

Well Township-
API Well Number Operator Well Name Well Status Type Field Name County Qtr/Qtr Section Range)

PATARAOIL
43-037-15049-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBOND-616 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NENE 16 305-24E 9

PATARAOIL
43-037-15123-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONB-615 Producing Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NENW 15 305-24E 7

PATARAOlL
43-037-15769-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONB912 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN SESW 12 305-24E

PATARAOIL
43-037-16219-00-00 & GAS LLC BIG INDIANUNIT1 Shut-In Oil Well BIG INDIAN(MADISON) SANJUAN SENE 33 295-24E

PATARAOIL Gas
43-037-16221-00-00 & GAS LLC BIG INDIAN4 Shut-In Well BIG INDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN SWSW 14 305-25E

Water
PATARAOIL Disposal

43-037-16237-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONA-715 Inactive Well LISBON SANJUAN SWNW 15 305-24E
PATARAOIL

43-037-16240-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONB-613 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NENW 13 305-24E
PATARAOIL

43-037-16242-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONB-616 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NESW 16 305-24E
Water

PATARAOIL BELCOST 4 Disposal 1
43-037-16244-00-00 & GAS LLC (LISBONB-816) Active Well LISBON SANJUAN NESW 16 305-24E

PATARAOIL ge
43-037-16245-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONC-69 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NWNE 9



PATARAOlL
43-037-16247-00-00 I &GAS LLC LISBONC-94 Shut-In I Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN SWSE 4 305-24E

y
PATARAOIL

43-037-16250-00-00 &GAS LLC LISBONUNIT D-84 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NESE 4 305-24E p
PATARAOIL

43-037-16251-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBOND-89 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NESE 9 305-24E g
PATARAOIL

43-037-16469-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONU B-610 Producing Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NENW 10 305-24E '

PATARAOIL NW LISBONUSAA- Gas
43-037-16471-00-00 & GAS LLC 2 (D-810) Producing Well LISBON SANJUAN NESE 10 305-24E

PATARAOIL
43-037-30054-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONB-84 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NESW 4 305-24E

Water
PATARAOIL Disposal

43-037-30082-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONB-814 Active Well LISBON SANJUAN NESW 14 305-24E
PATARAOIL Gas

43-037-30317-00-00 & GAS LLC FEDERAL15-25 Shut-In Well WILSONCANYON SANJUAN SWSE 25 295-23E *

PATARAOIL
43-037-30693-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONC-99 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN SWSE 9 305-24E

PATARAOIL Gas
43-037-30694-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONU D-610 Shut-In Well LISBON SANJUAN NENE 10 305-24E

PATARAOIL
43-037-30695-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONB-94 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN SESW 4 305-24E

PATARAOIL Gas 2
43-037-31014-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONUNITA-911 Producing Well LISBON SANJUAN SWSW 11 305-24E

PATARAOIL 3
43-037-31034-00-00 &GAS LLC LISBONUNIT D-716 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN SENE 16 305-24E

PATARAOIL y
43-037-31323-00-00 &GAS LLC LISBONC-910 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN SWSE 10 305-24E

PATARAOIL 5
43-037-31351-00-00 &GAS LLC LISBONB-614A Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NENW 14 305-24E

PATARAOIL
43-037-31433-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONB-810 Producing Oil We!I LISBON SANJUAN NESW 10

PATARAOlL
43-037-16247-00-00 I &GAS LLC LISBONC-94 Shut-In I Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN SWSE 4 305-24E

y
PATARAOIL

43-037-16250-00-00 &GAS LLC LISBONUNIT D-84 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NESE 4 305-24E p
PATARAOIL

43-037-16251-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBOND-89 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NESE 9 305-24E g
PATARAOIL

43-037-16469-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONU B-610 Producing Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NENW 10 305-24E '

PATARAOIL NW LISBONUSAA- Gas
43-037-16471-00-00 & GAS LLC 2 (D-810) Producing Well LISBON SANJUAN NESE 10 305-24E

PATARAOIL
43-037-30054-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONB-84 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NESW 4 305-24E

Water
PATARAOIL Disposal

43-037-30082-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONB-814 Active Well LISBON SANJUAN NESW 14 305-24E
PATARAOIL Gas

43-037-30317-00-00 & GAS LLC FEDERAL15-25 Shut-In Well WILSONCANYON SANJUAN SWSE 25 295-23E *

PATARAOIL
43-037-30693-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONC-99 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN SWSE 9 305-24E

PATARAOIL Gas
43-037-30694-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONU D-610 Shut-In Well LISBON SANJUAN NENE 10 305-24E

PATARAOIL
43-037-30695-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONB-94 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN SESW 4 305-24E

PATARAOIL Gas 2
43-037-31014-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONUNITA-911 Producing Well LISBON SANJUAN SWSW 11 305-24E

PATARAOIL 3
43-037-31034-00-00 &GAS LLC LISBONUNIT D-716 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN SENE 16 305-24E

PATARAOIL y
43-037-31323-00-00 &GAS LLC LISBONC-910 Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN SWSE 10 305-24E

PATARAOIL 5
43-037-31351-00-00 &GAS LLC LISBONB-614A Shut-In Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NENW 14 305-24E

PATARAOIL
43-037-31433-00-00 & GAS LLC LISBONB-810 Producing Oil We!I LISBON SANJUAN NESW 10



PATARAOIL Gas
43-037-31829-00-00 & GAS LLC BIGINDIAN35-24 Shut-In Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN SENE 35 295-24E O

PATARAOIL BULLHORN U 10- Gas
43-037-31831-00-00 & GAS LLC 43 Producing Well BIGINDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN SWSE 10 305-25E

PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESAST Gas
43-037-31838-00-00 & GAS LLC 36-14-29-24 Producing Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN NENE 36 295-24E

PATARAOIL BULLHORN FED9- Gas
43-037-31843-00-00 & GAS LLC 14-30-25 Producing Well BIGINDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN NENE 9 305-25E

PATARAOIL BULLHORN FED Gas
43-037-31848-00-00 & GAS LLC 15-14-30-25 Producing Well BIGINDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN NENE 15 305-25E

PATARAOlL BULLHORN FED Gas
43-037-31849-00-00 & GAS LLC 10-21-30-25 Producing Well BIGINDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN NWSW 10 30S-25E

PATARAOIL BIGINDIANFED14- Gas
43-037-31850-00-00 & GAS LLC 21-30-25 Producing Well BIGINDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN SWNW 14 305-25E

PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESAFED Gas
43-037-31853-00-00 & GAS LLC 5-6-30-25 Producing Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN LOT6 5 305-25E

PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESAFED Gas
43-037-31854-00-00 & GAS LLC 31-31-29-25 Producing Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN NWSW 31 295-25E

PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESAST Gas -

43-037-31855-00-00 & GAS LLC 36-12-29-24 Shut-In Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN NENW 36 295-24E
PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESAST Gas

43-037-31856-00-00 & GAS LLC 36-24-29-24 Producing Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN SENE 36 295-24E
PATARAOIL BIGINDIANFED15- Gas

43-037-31859-00-00 & GAS LLC 24-30-25 Shut-In Well BIGINDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN SWNW 14 305-25E
PATARAOlL BIGINDIANFED14- Gas A

43-037-31860-00-00 & GAS LLC 42-30-25 Producing Well BIGINDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN SESW 14 305-25E
PATARAOIL BULLHORN FED Gas

43-037-31861-00-00 & GAS LLC 10-42-30-25 Shut-In Well BIGINDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN SESW 10 305-25E
PATARAOIL BULLHORN FED Gas

43-037-31864-00-00 & GAS LLC 10-31-30-25 Producing Well BIGINDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN NWSW 10 30S-25E
PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESAST Gas

43-037-31877-00-00 & GAS LLC 36-12B-29-24 Producing Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN NENW 36

PATARAOIL Gas
43-037-31829-00-00 & GAS LLC BIGINDIAN35-24 Shut-In Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN SENE 35 295-24E O

PATARAOIL BULLHORN U 10- Gas
43-037-31831-00-00 & GAS LLC 43 Producing Well BIGINDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN SWSE 10 305-25E

PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESAST Gas
43-037-31838-00-00 & GAS LLC 36-14-29-24 Producing Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN NENE 36 295-24E

PATARAOIL BULLHORN FED9- Gas
43-037-31843-00-00 & GAS LLC 14-30-25 Producing Well BIGINDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN NENE 9 305-25E

PATARAOIL BULLHORN FED Gas
43-037-31848-00-00 & GAS LLC 15-14-30-25 Producing Well BIGINDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN NENE 15 305-25E

PATARAOlL BULLHORN FED Gas
43-037-31849-00-00 & GAS LLC 10-21-30-25 Producing Well BIGINDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN NWSW 10 30S-25E

PATARAOIL BIGINDIANFED14- Gas
43-037-31850-00-00 & GAS LLC 21-30-25 Producing Well BIGINDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN SWNW 14 305-25E

PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESAFED Gas
43-037-31853-00-00 & GAS LLC 5-6-30-25 Producing Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN LOT6 5 305-25E

PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESAFED Gas
43-037-31854-00-00 & GAS LLC 31-31-29-25 Producing Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN NWSW 31 295-25E

PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESAST Gas -

43-037-31855-00-00 & GAS LLC 36-12-29-24 Shut-In Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN NENW 36 295-24E
PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESAST Gas

43-037-31856-00-00 & GAS LLC 36-24-29-24 Producing Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN SENE 36 295-24E
PATARAOIL BIGINDIANFED15- Gas

43-037-31859-00-00 & GAS LLC 24-30-25 Shut-In Well BIGINDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN SWNW 14 305-25E
PATARAOlL BIGINDIANFED14- Gas A

43-037-31860-00-00 & GAS LLC 42-30-25 Producing Well BIGINDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN SESW 14 305-25E
PATARAOIL BULLHORN FED Gas

43-037-31861-00-00 & GAS LLC 10-42-30-25 Shut-In Well BIGINDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN SESW 10 305-25E
PATARAOIL BULLHORN FED Gas

43-037-31864-00-00 & GAS LLC 10-31-30-25 Producing Well BIGINDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN NWSW 10 30S-25E
PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESAST Gas

43-037-31877-00-00 & GAS LLC 36-12B-29-24 Producing Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN NENW 36



PATARAOIL MIDDLE MESAST Gas
43-037-31878-00-00 & GAS LLC 36-24B-29-24 Producing Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN SENE 36 29S-24E -

PATARAOIL BIGINDIANFED15- Gas
43-037-31883-00-00 & GAS LLC 24B-30-25 Shut-In Well BIGINDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN SWNW 14 305-25E R

Approved
permit (APD); 9

PATARAOIL BIGINDIANFED 23- not yet Gas
43-037-31884-00-00 & GAS LLC 13B-30-25 spudded Well BIG INDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN NWNE 23 30S-25E

Approved
permit (APD);

PATARAOIL BIGINDIANFED23- not yet Gas
43-037-31885-00-00 & GAS LLC 13-30-25 spudded Well BIG INDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN NWNE 23 305-25E

PATARA OlL BULLHORN FED Gas
43-037-31891-00-00 & GAS LLC 15-13-30-25 Producing Well BIG INDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN NENE 15 305-25E

Approved
permit (APD);

PATARAOlL MIDDLE MESA FED not yet Gas
43-037-31893-00-00 & GAS LLC 30-41-29-25 spudded Well UNDESIGNATED SANJUAN SWSW 30 295-25E

Spudded
(Drilling
commenced:

PATARA OIL MIDDLEMESAFED Not yet Gas
43-037-31897-00-00 & GAS LLC 5-10-30-25 completed) Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SAN JUAN LT10 5 305-25E

Approved
permit (APD);

PATARA OIL MIDDLEMESAFED not yet Gas
43-037-31901-00-00 & GAS LLC 25-43-29-24 spudded Well UNDESIGNATED SANJUAN SWSE 25 29S-24E

PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESAFED Gas
43-037-31902-00-00 & GAS LLC 25-41-29-24 Producing Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN SWSW 25 295-24E

PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESAFED Gas
43-037-31903-00-00 & GAS LLC 25-31-29-24 Producing Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN NWSW 25 295-24E

PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESAFED Gas
43-037-31904-00-00 & GAS LLC 26-34-29-24 Producing Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN NESW 26

PATARAOIL MIDDLE MESAST Gas
43-037-31878-00-00 & GAS LLC 36-24B-29-24 Producing Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN SENE 36 29S-24E -

PATARAOIL BIGINDIANFED15- Gas
43-037-31883-00-00 & GAS LLC 24B-30-25 Shut-In Well BIGINDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN SWNW 14 305-25E R

Approved
permit (APD); 9

PATARAOIL BIGINDIANFED 23- not yet Gas
43-037-31884-00-00 & GAS LLC 13B-30-25 spudded Well BIG INDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN NWNE 23 30S-25E

Approved
permit (APD);

PATARAOIL BIGINDIANFED23- not yet Gas
43-037-31885-00-00 & GAS LLC 13-30-25 spudded Well BIG INDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN NWNE 23 305-25E

PATARA OlL BULLHORN FED Gas
43-037-31891-00-00 & GAS LLC 15-13-30-25 Producing Well BIG INDIAN(HERMOSA) SANJUAN NENE 15 305-25E

Approved
permit (APD);

PATARAOlL MIDDLE MESA FED not yet Gas
43-037-31893-00-00 & GAS LLC 30-41-29-25 spudded Well UNDESIGNATED SANJUAN SWSW 30 295-25E

Spudded
(Drilling
commenced:

PATARA OIL MIDDLEMESAFED Not yet Gas
43-037-31897-00-00 & GAS LLC 5-10-30-25 completed) Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SAN JUAN LT10 5 305-25E

Approved
permit (APD);

PATARA OIL MIDDLEMESAFED not yet Gas
43-037-31901-00-00 & GAS LLC 25-43-29-24 spudded Well UNDESIGNATED SANJUAN SWSE 25 29S-24E

PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESAFED Gas
43-037-31902-00-00 & GAS LLC 25-41-29-24 Producing Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN SWSW 25 295-24E

PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESAFED Gas
43-037-31903-00-00 & GAS LLC 25-31-29-24 Producing Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN NWSW 25 295-24E

PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESAFED Gas
43-037-31904-00-00 & GAS LLC 26-34-29-24 Producing Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN NESW 26



Approved
permit (APD);

PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESA FED not yet Gas
43-037-31905-00-00 & GAS LLC 26-23-29-24 spudded Well UNDESIGNATED SANJUAN SWNE 26 295-24E

PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESA FED Gas
43-037-31906-00-00 & GAS LLC 31-44-29-25 Producing Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN SESE 31 295-25E

PATARAOIL MIDDLE MESA FED Gas
43-037-31907-00-00 & GAS LLC 31-33-29-25 Producing Well SOUTH PINERIDGE SANJUAN NWSE 31 295-25E

Approved
permit (APD);

PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESA FED not yet Gas
43-037-31909-00-00 & GAS LLC 31-22-29-25 spudded Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN SENW 31 295-25E

Approved
permit (APD);

PATARA OIL MIDDLEMESA FED not yet Gas
43-037-31910-00-00 & GAS LLC 31-11-29-25 spudded Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN NWNW 31 295-25E

PATARAOIL Temporarily- Gas
43-037-50008-00-00 & GAS LLC CISCOSTATE36-13 Abandoned Well WILDCAT SANJUAN NWNE 36 315-24E '

PATARAOIL MIDDLE MESA FED Gas
43-037-50010-00-00 &GAS LLC 4-20-30-25 Producing Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN SWNW 4 305-25E GG

Returned
PATARAOIL APD

43-037-50012-00-00 & GAS LLC Lisbon 11-32MC (Unapproved) Oil Well UNDESIGNATED SANJUAN SWNE 11 305-24E
Approved
permit (APD);

PATARAOIL not yet
43-037-50013-00-00 & GAS LLC Lisbon 14-11MC spudded Oil Well LISBON SAN JUAN NWNW 14 305-24E

Approved 3
permit (APD);

PATARAOIL not yet
43-037-50014-00-00 & GAS LLC Lisbon 10-44MC spudded Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NWNW 14

Approved
permit (APD);

PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESA FED not yet Gas
43-037-31905-00-00 & GAS LLC 26-23-29-24 spudded Well UNDESIGNATED SANJUAN SWNE 26 295-24E

PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESA FED Gas
43-037-31906-00-00 & GAS LLC 31-44-29-25 Producing Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN SESE 31 295-25E

PATARAOIL MIDDLE MESA FED Gas
43-037-31907-00-00 & GAS LLC 31-33-29-25 Producing Well SOUTH PINERIDGE SANJUAN NWSE 31 295-25E

Approved
permit (APD);

PATARAOIL MIDDLEMESA FED not yet Gas
43-037-31909-00-00 & GAS LLC 31-22-29-25 spudded Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN SENW 31 295-25E

Approved
permit (APD);

PATARA OIL MIDDLEMESA FED not yet Gas
43-037-31910-00-00 & GAS LLC 31-11-29-25 spudded Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN NWNW 31 295-25E

PATARAOIL Temporarily- Gas
43-037-50008-00-00 & GAS LLC CISCOSTATE36-13 Abandoned Well WILDCAT SANJUAN NWNE 36 315-24E '

PATARAOIL MIDDLE MESA FED Gas
43-037-50010-00-00 &GAS LLC 4-20-30-25 Producing Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN SWNW 4 305-25E GG

Returned
PATARAOIL APD

43-037-50012-00-00 & GAS LLC Lisbon 11-32MC (Unapproved) Oil Well UNDESIGNATED SANJUAN SWNE 11 305-24E
Approved
permit (APD);

PATARAOIL not yet
43-037-50013-00-00 & GAS LLC Lisbon 14-11MC spudded Oil Well LISBON SAN JUAN NWNW 14 305-24E

Approved 3
permit (APD);

PATARAOIL not yet
43-037-50014-00-00 & GAS LLC Lisbon 10-44MC spudded Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NWNW 14



Approved
permit (APD);

PATARAOIL not yet
43-037-50015-00-00 & GAS LLC Lisbon 3-32MC spudded Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NESE 4 305-24E

Approved
permit (APD);

PATARAOIL not yet
43-037-50016-00-00 &GAS LLC Lisbon 11-33MC spudded Oil Well USBON SANJUAN NENW 14 305-24E

Approved
permit (APD);

PATARAOIL not yet Gas
43-037-50017-00-00 &GAS LLC Lisbon 11-21MC spudded Well LISBON SANJUAN NWSE 10 305-24E

Approved
permit (APD);

PATARAOIL not yet
43-037-50018-00-00 & GAS LLC Lisbon 3-43MC spudded Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN SESE 3 305-24E

Spudded
(Drilling
commenced:

PATARAOIL Not yet
43-037-50019-00-00 & GAS LLC Lisbon 10-33MC completed) Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NWSE 10 305-24E

Approved ---

permit (APD);
PATARAOIL Middle Mesa Fed not yet Gas

43-037-50021-00-00 & GAS LLC 31-42-29-25 spudded Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN SESW 31 295-25E

Approved
permit (APD); 3

PATARAOIL Middle Mesa not yet Gas
43-037-50026-00-00 &GAS LLC Federal 5-8-30-25 spudded Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN NENE 5

Approved
permit (APD);

PATARAOIL not yet
43-037-50015-00-00 & GAS LLC Lisbon 3-32MC spudded Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NESE 4 305-24E

Approved
permit (APD);

PATARAOIL not yet
43-037-50016-00-00 &GAS LLC Lisbon 11-33MC spudded Oil Well USBON SANJUAN NENW 14 305-24E

Approved
permit (APD);

PATARAOIL not yet Gas
43-037-50017-00-00 &GAS LLC Lisbon 11-21MC spudded Well LISBON SANJUAN NWSE 10 305-24E

Approved
permit (APD);

PATARAOIL not yet
43-037-50018-00-00 & GAS LLC Lisbon 3-43MC spudded Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN SESE 3 305-24E

Spudded
(Drilling
commenced:

PATARAOIL Not yet
43-037-50019-00-00 & GAS LLC Lisbon 10-33MC completed) Oil Well LISBON SANJUAN NWSE 10 305-24E

Approved ---

permit (APD);
PATARAOIL Middle Mesa Fed not yet Gas

43-037-50021-00-00 & GAS LLC 31-42-29-25 spudded Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN SESW 31 295-25E

Approved
permit (APD); 3

PATARAOIL Middle Mesa not yet Gas
43-037-50026-00-00 &GAS LLC Federal 5-8-30-25 spudded Well SOUTH PINE RIDGE SANJUAN NENE 5



United States Department of the Interior 

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 

IN REPLY REFER TO: 

3180 (UTU82680A) 
UT-922200 

Ms. Kelsey Silipo 
CCI Paradox Upstream, LLC 
600 17th Street, Suite 1900S 
Denver, Colorado 80202 

Dear Ms. Silipo: 

Utah State Office 
440 West 200 South, Suite 500 

Salt Lake City, UT 84101 
http://www.blm.gov/ut/st/en.html 

FEB 062015 
RECE\VED 
fEB II 2\),:) 

D1V. Of Oll, G~S & MINING 

Re: 5th Revision of the Hermosa Group P A 
Middle Mesa Unit, San Juan County, Utah 

The 5th Revision of the Hermosa Group Participating Area (P A), Middle Mesa Unit, CRS No. 

UTU82680A, San Juan County, Utah, is hereby.approved effective as of August 1,2011 (the fIrst of 

the month Well No. 26-34-29-24, API No. 43-037-31904, located in NEY-.SEY-., of Section 26, 

Township 29 South, Range 24 East, Federal Lease No. UTU76053 had actual sales) pursuant to 

Section 11 of the Middle Mesa Unit Agreement. 

This revision results in the addition of 200.00 acres to the 4th Revsion of the Honaker Trail 

Particpating Area for a total of739.68 acres and is based upon the completion in the Honaker Trail 

and Ismay formations of Well No. 31-44-29-25, API No. 43-037-31906, located in SE'I4SE'I4, of 

Section 31, Township 29 South, Range 25 East, Federal Lease No. UTU76335 and the completion in 

the Honaker Trail formation of Well No. 26-34-29-24, API No. 43-037-31904, located in NEY-.SE'I4, 

ofSectioil26, Township 29 South, Range 24 East, Federal Lease No. UTU76053. The participating 

area now covers the entire Hermosa Group. Both wells are capable of producing unitized substances 

in paying quantities. 

United States Department of the Interior - -

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
. Utah State Office

440 West 200 South, Suite 500
Salt Lake City, UT 84101

http://www.blm.govlut/st/en.html

INREPLYREFERTO:
FEB0 6 2015

FEB11 N
3180 (UTU82680A)
UT-922200 gly.0F OIL.OASA

Ms. Kelsey Silipo
CCI Paradox Upstream, LLC
600 17* Street, Suite 1900S
Denver, Colorado 80202

Re: 5th Revision of the Hermosa Group PA
Middle Mesa Unit, San Juan County, Utah

Dear Ms. Silipo:

The 5th Revision of the Hermosa Group Participating Area (PA), Middle Mesa Unit, CRS No.
UTU82680A, San Juan County, Utah, is hereby approved effective as of August 1,2011 (the firstof
the month Well No. 26-34-29-24, API No. 43-037-31904, located in NE¼SE¼, of Section 26,
Township 29 South, Range 24 East, Federal Lease No. UTU76053 had actual sales) pursuant to
Section 11 of the Middle Mesa Unit Agreement.

This revision results in the addition of 200.00 acres to the 4th Revsion of the Honaker Trail
Particpating Area for a totalof 739.68 acres and is based upon the completion in the Honaker Trail
and Ismay formations of Well No. 31-44-29-25, API No. 43-037-31906, located in SE¼SE¼, of
Section 31, Township 29 South, Range 25 East, Federal LeaseNo. UTU76335 and the completion in
the Honaker Trail formation of Well No. 26-34-29-24,APINo. 43-037-31904, locatedinNE¼SE¼,
of Section 26, Township 29 South, Range 24 East, Federal Lease No. UTU76053. The participating
area now covers the entire Hermosa Group. Both wells are capable of producing unitized substances
in paying



The following wells should be reported to the Hermosa Group Participating Area effective August 1, 

2011. 

API WELL NAME Surface Location LEASE 

4303731838 36-14-29-24 0756 FNL 0760 FEL 36 T29.0S R24.0E ML-37067 

4303731853 5-6-30-25 1002 FNL 2284 FWL 05 T30.0S R25.0E UTU-84218 

4303731854 31-31-29-25 2126 FSL 0810 FWL 31 T29.0S R25.0E UTU-84217 

4303731855 36-12-29-24 1097 FNL 2216 FWL 36 T29.0S R24.0E ST-UT-37067 

4303731856 36-24-29-24 2569 FNL 1183 FEL 36 T29.0S R24.0E ML-37067 

4303731877 36-12B-29-24 1105 FNL 2228 FWL 36 T29.0S R24.0E ST-UT-37067 

4303731878 36-24B-29:.24 2562 FNL 1172 FEL 36 T29.0S R24.0E ST-UT-37067 

4303731902 25-41-29-24 0360 FSL 0960 FWL 25 T29.0S R24.0E UTU-76053 

4303731903 25-31-29-24 2361 FSL 0900 FWL 25 T29.0S R24.0E UTU-76053 

4303731904 26-34-29-24 2011 FSL 0789 FEL 26 T29.0S R24.0E UTU-76053 

4303731906 31-44-29-25 0587 FSL 1207 FEL 31 T29.0S R25.0E UTU-76335 

4303731907 31-33-29-25 1873 FSL 1795 FEL 31 T29.0S R25.0E UTU-76335 

4303750021 31-42-29-25 0557 FSL 2344 FWL 31 T29.0S R25.0E UTU-84217 

For production and accounting reporting purposes, all submissions pertaining to the Hermosa Group 

P A shall refer to UTU82680A. 

Copies of the approved'request are being distributed to the appropriate agencies and one copy is 

returned herewith. Please advise all interested parties of the approval of the 5th Revision of the 

Hermosa Group P A, Middle Mesa Unit, and its effective date. 

Please direct any questions concerning this approval to Judy Nordstrom of this office at (801) 539-

4108. 

Enclosure 

cc: UDOGM 
SITLA 
ONRR wlExhibit B (Attn: Curtis Link)_ 
BLM FOM - Moab w/enclosure 

Sincerely, 

fly,;!- &t4L~ 
Roger L. Bankert 
Chief, Branch of Minerals 

The following wells should be reported to the Hermosa Group Participating Area effectiveAugust 1,
2011.

API WELL NAME Surface Location LEASE
4303731838 36-14-29-24 0756 FNL 0760 FEL 36 T29.0S R24.0E ML-37067
4303731853 5-6-30-25 1002 FNL 2284 FWL 05 T30.0S R25.0E UTU-84218
4303731854 31-31-29-25 2126 FSL 0810 FWL 31 T29.0S R25.0E UTU-84217
4303731855 36-12-29-24 1097 FNL 2216 FWL 36 T29.0S R24.0E ST-UT-37067
4303731856 36-24-29-24 2569 FNL 1183 FEL 36 T29.0S R24.0E ML-37067
4303731877 36-12B-29-24 1105 FNL 2228 FWL 36 T29.0S R24.0E ST-UT-37067

4303731878 36-24B-29-24 2562 FNL 1172 FEL 36 T29.0S R24.0E ST-UT-37067
4303731902 25-41-29-24 0360 FSL 0960 FWL 25 T29.0S R24.0E UTU-76053
4303731903 25-31-29-24 2361 FSL 0900 FWL 25 T29.0S R24.0E UTU-76053
4303731904 26-34-29-24 2011 FSL 0789 FEL 26 T29.0S R24.0E UTU-76053

4303731906 31-44-29-25 0587 FSL 1207 FEL 31 T29.0S R25.0E UTU-76335
4303731907 31-33-29-25 1873 FSL 1795 FEL 31 T29.0S R25.0E UTU-76335
4303750021 31-42-29-25 0557 FSL 2344 FWL 31 T29.0S R25.0E UTU-84217

For production and accounting reporting purposes, all submissions pertaining to the Hermosa Group
PA shall refer to UTU82680A.

Copies of the approved'request are being distributed to the appropriate agencies and one copy is
returned herewith. Please advise all interested parties of the approval of the 5th Revision of the
Hermosa Group PA, Middle Mesa Unit, and its effective date.

Please direct any questions concerning this approval to Judy Nordstrom of this office at (801) 539-

4108.
Sinc l

Roger L. Bankert
Chief, Branch of Minerals

Enclosure

cc: UDOGM
SITLA
ONRR w/Exhibit B (Attn: Curtis Link)
BLM FOM - Moab



United States Department of the Interior 

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 

IN REPLY REFER TO: 

3180 (UTU82680X) 
UT-922000 

Utah State Office 
440 West 200 South, Suite 500 
Salt Lake City, UT 84101-1345 

http://www.hlm.gov/ut/st/en.html 

RECE\VED 
Ms. Kelsey Silipo MAY 01 20\5 
CCI Paradox Upstream, LLC \1.13<145 G 
600 17th Street, Suite 1900S OW. Of OIL, GAS & M\N\N 
Denver, Colorado 80202 

APR J 8' 2015 

Re: Automatic Contraction 
Middle Mesa Unit 
San Juan County, Utah 

Dear Ms. Silipo: 

Your letter of April 13, 2015, describes the lands automatically eliminated effective October 1, 
2013, from the Middle Mesa Unit Area, located in San Juan County, Utah, pursuant to Section 
2( e) of the unit agreement and requests our concurrence. The lands you have described contain 
8,894.57 acres more or less, and constitute all legal subdivisions, no parts of which are included 
in the 5th Revision of the Hermosa Group Participating Area and the Initial Hermosa 
Participating Area "B". As a result of the automatic contraction, the unit is reduced to 899.68 
acres. 

The following Federal Leases are entirely eliminated from the unit area: 

UTU16577 
UTU76327 
UTU76776 
UTU77076 
UTU77077 
UTU77372 
UTU77539 

UTU 78735 
UTU 80058 
UTU 84215 
UTU84216 
UTU87212 
UTU87222 
UTU88837* 

*Indicates non-committed lease 

United States De artment of the Interior -......--P .............

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office

440 West 200 South, Suite 500
Salt Lake City, UT 84101-1345

http://www.blm.gov/ut/st/en.html

IN REPLY REFER TO:

3180 (UTU82680X)
UT-922000

RECEWED ****206

Ms. Kelsey Silipo gy 01 RE
CCI Paradox Upstream, LLC MM45
600 17thStreet, Suite 1900S

og.0FOIL,GASaWN\NG

Denver, Colorado 80202
Re: Automatic Contraction

Middle Mesa Unit
San Juan County, Utah

Dear Ms. Silipo:

Your letter of April 13, 2015, describes the lands automatically eliminated effective October 1,
2013, from the Middle Mesa Unit Area, located in San Juan County, Utah, pursuant to Section
2(e) of the unit agreement and requests our concurrence. The lands you have described contain
8,894.57 acres more or less, and constitute all legal subdivisions, no parts of which are included
in the 5th Revision of the Hermosa Group Participating Area and the Initial Hermosa
Participating Area "B". As a result of the automatic contraction, the unit is reduced to 899.68
acres.

The following Federal Leases are entirely eliminated from the unit area:

UTUl6577 UTU 78735
UTU76327 UTU 80058
UTU76776 UTU 84215
UTU77076 UTU84216
UTU77077 UTU87212
UTU77372 UTU87222
UTU77539 UTU88837*

*Indicates non-committed



The following Federal Leases are partially eliminated from the unit area. 

UTU84217 
UTU84218 
UTU76053 
UTU76335 
UTU77538 

You have complied with the requirements of Section 2( e), provided you promptly notifY all 

interested parties. 

If you have any questions, please contact Judy Nordstrom of this office at (801) 539-4108. 

Sincerely, 

Roger L. Bankert 
Chief, Branch of Minerals 

Enclosure 

cc: UDOGM 
SITLA 
ONRR wlExhibit "B" (Attn: Curtis Link) 
BLM Field Office Manager - Moab (UTY01) w/enclosure 

The following Federal Leases are partially eliminated from the unit area.

UTU84217
UTU84218
UTU76053
UTU76335
UTU77538

You have complied with the requirements of Section 2(e), provided you promptly notify all
interested parties.

If you have any questions, please contact Judy Nordstrom of this office at (801) 539-4108.

Sincerely,

Roger L. Bankert
Chief, Branch of Minerals

Enclosure

cc: UDOGM
SITLA
ONRR w/Exhibit "B" (Attn: Curtis Link)
BLM Field Office Manager -- Moab (UTY01)



Middle Mesa Unit Contraction 
Effective 4/30/2015 

Well Name 
BIG INDIAN 35-24 
MIDDLE MESA FED 26-34-29-24 
MIDDLE MESA FED 25-31-29-24 
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-33-29-25 
MIDDLE MESA FED 4-20-30-25 
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-44-29-25 
MIDDLE MESA FED 5-10-30-25 
MIDDLE MESA FED 26-23-29-24 
MIDDLE MESA FED 31-22-29-25 

Section TWN 
35 290S 
26 290S 
25 290S 
31 290S 
4 300S 
31 290S 
5 300S 
26 290S 
31 290S 

RNG API Number Type Status 
240E 4303731829 GW P 
240E 4303731904 GW P 
240E 4303731903 GW P 
250E 4303731907 GW P 

-~ 

250E 4303750010 GW P 
250E 4303731906 GW P 
250E 4303731897 GW P 
240E 4303731905 GW P 
250E 4303731909 GW APD 

1 5/11/2015 

Middle Mesa Unit Contraction
Effective 4/30/2015

Well Name Section TWN RNG API Number Type Status
BIGINDIAN35-24 35 290S 240E 4303731829 GW P
MIDDLEMESA FED 26-34-29-24 26 290S 240E 4303731904 GW P
MIDDLEMESA FED 25-31-29-24 25 290S 240E 4303731903 GW P
MIDDLEMESA FED 31-33-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731907 GW P
MIDDLEMESA FED 4-20-30-25 4 300S 250E 4303750010 GW P
MIDDLEMESA FED 31-44-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731906 GW P
MIDDLEMESA FED 5-10-30-25 5 300S 250E 4303731897 GW P
MIDDLEMESA FED 26-23-29-24 26 290S 240E 4303731905 GW P
MIDDLEMESA FED 31-22-29-25 31 290S 250E 4303731909 GW APD

1
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