® N

STATE OF UTAH FORM 3
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES '
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING  AMENDED REPORT [ ]

(highlight changes)

5. MINERAL LEASE NO:  |6. SURFACE:
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL UTUO76834 | Nattomal Forest
7. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
1A TYPE OF WORK; DRILL[X] ~ REENTER[ | DEEPEN[ ] .-
B.TYPEOFWELL:  OIL GAS OTHER SINGLE ZONE MULTIPLE ZONE 8. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
‘ D IXI IXI I:I Devil Mesa Unit - UTU-085849X
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Baytex Energy USA Lid. Devil Mesa Unit 1-13
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: - PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
600 17th Street, Suite 1900 South, Denver CcO #H 820 a0k .
CITY STATE _ zIP 303-825-2777 MLU’LM S‘lmﬁfcm
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) : 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSH!P, RANGE,
(P‘ﬂ.gwa(' (H%gﬂ‘ﬁ\l[ 37, @QOZQ{ -104.34 0o0¢( MERIDIAN:
URFAGE: 1522' FNL 2,419' FWL SE /4 NW /4  Sec. 13
AT PROPOSED PRODUGING ZONE:  **11,600' FNL +1,700° FEL Sec, 13 T36S R23E (SW/4 NE/4) T 36S R 23E S.L.M.
L ggzzgé ’_‘“Qé@l% 37.(e[aoorgt¢ "104»53 £509l
14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTIDN FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:
8 miles northeast of Blanding, UT San Juan Utah
15. DISTANCE TO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE (FEET): 16. NUMBER OF ACRES IN LEASE: 17. NUMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:
Lease: 2,435 Property: 1,255' 960.00 160.00
18. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING, COMPLETED, OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:
APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET) ' . . :
1,775 - . East Mustang 13-11 6,365 Applied for {H3-800295
21. ELEVATIONS (SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATE DATE WORK WILL START: 23. ESTIMATED DURATION: |
6,118' GR Upon Approval " 30-45 days drlg + completion
24. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY, YIELD, AND SLURRY WEIGHT
11" 8-5/8" J-b5 244 ST&C 0'-2,175' |To surface (+380 sxs Lite and +140 sxs Prem)
7-7/8" 4-1/2" J-5511.6# LT &C T.D. T.D. to surface (+345 sxs Lite + 265 sxs 50/50 poz)
25. : ATTACHMENTS

VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES:

EWELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER ECOMPLETE DRILLING PLAN
EEVIDENCE OF DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER EFQRM 5, IF OPERATOR 18 PERSON OR COMPANY OTHER THAN THE LEASE
OWNER

Permit Agent for:
NAME (PLEASE PRINT) David F. Banko _, : nre _Baytex Energy USA Ltd.

SIGNATURE @/ /O,,/Lé‘/ DATE November 28, 2007

(This space for State use only) w the ) 3
IR Utahblvlsbiqud : RECEIVED

API NUMBER ASSIGNED: (/}J 3 -3/ 5 79 APPROVAL: | NOV 29 2007

000 | ? o\l ZOK1212 DIV.OF o, GAS&MINING.
Ao SINAAL
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Ground Elev. 6118 feet. S
Finished Grade 6119 feet.

= 200’

100 200

Rev. November 1, 2007 °

A‘w E, 80.22 Chains (5292.52 Feet) From on.ut |_PacE 1 of 5
' > N 89N E T
N 1/4 COR SEC 13
NW Cor Sec. 1, S::uf: d) NE Cor Sec. 13
No Monument " : No Monument
= Found Found
| ) o
QS L [N | B
on 2 ) &R
oM o
B EGE
=z [~]
o 1
3 2419 ' g
S 3
L 1
> ] hg.
k e~y
E 1/4 Cor Sec. 13 é
§ _ : No Monument Found 2
e I §
§<>—°° -- -- -- - - -- -- -- o
Q
& |Wiss cor | DAVIS PETROLEUM CORP. |3
8 . DEVIL MESA UNIT 1-13 &
x ! Section 13, T.36S., R.23E., 3
B ! S.L.M., &
8 |w _ San Juan County, Utah 3
z 'c)'tog |
No & 1
B8 §
3Nz
7 Elevation Derived From 1
GPS Observations: 6230' |
. (Devil Mesa, Utah,
Provisional Edition 1985 Quad Sheet
Elev. ~6225) | SE Cor Sec. 13
S 89'52'31" W ' No Monument SCALE : 1" =1000’
2647.05' -
) (Measured) ls 1/4 COR SEC 13 Found E
Y SW COR SEC 13 S 896" W, 60\18 Chairs (5291.88 Feet) From GLO Plat . p——
LEGEND .

NOTES

1) Bearings are based on GPS observations.
2) Surface ownership — Public Lands

3) Elevations are based on GPS observations post

processed with OPUS )b ool :
4) Surface area:Pinion — Juniper “E@“E VED
5) Initial field survey: October 24, 2007. D
6) No visible improvements within 200’ of site. EC 1 9 2007
7) Well locations based on GPS observotlonB
Lat. 37.66018N Long. 109.34081W M OF CiL, gag & il
UTM 4169203.6N, 646411.7E NAD 27 Zone 12 iINING

8) GPS receivers set to exciude PDOP values over 6.

by these presents :
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plat N A\ cctual ond accurote survey of the Land and that the
and correct to the best of my knowledge and belief.

:-/(/4

elston, Utah. Reg. #161297

£ NESS & Associates Inc.
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ety g—— '\ j/‘.
28 S. Washington - P.O, Box 1163 -
Phone: 970/565—_8__845
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Cortez, CO. 81321




DAVIS PETROLEUM CORP.

DEVIL MESA UNIT AREA

SAN JUAN COUNTY, UT
November 14, 2007

Devil Mesa Unit 1-13
SHL: 1,522’ FNL 2,419’ FWL
(SE/4 NW/4) Sec. 13 T36S R23E
BHL: £1,600” FNL +1,700° FEL
(SW/4 NE/4) Sec. 13 T36S R23E
San Juan County, Utah
Federal Mineral Lease: UTU76834
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Job Number: Q070600
Company: Baytex Energy Trust
Lease/Well: Devil Mesa Unit #1-13

Location: San Juan County

State/Country: Utah

Declination: 11.08608

Grid: -1.08 J‘
File name: C:\LTSTDSB\TEMP\HARDDR~1\CUSTOM~1\DAVISP~1\Q0706001Q070600

Rig Name: Date/Time: 16-Nov-07 / 11:14
RKB: Curve Name: Devil Mesa Unit #1-13 (r1)
G.L.orM.S.L.:

WINSERVE PROPOSAL REPORT
Minimum Curvature Method
Vertical Section Plane 93.84
Vertical Section Referenced to Wellhead
Rectangular Coordinates Referenced to Wellhead

Measured Incl Drift True Vertical Dogleg CLOSURE

Depth Angle Direction Vertical Section N-S E-w Severity Distance Direction FNL-FSL  FEL-FWL

FT Deg Deg Depth FT FT FT Deg/100 FT Deg FT FT

KOP @ 2275' TVD Begin Build @ 3.00°/100'
2275.00 .00 .00 2275.00 .00 .00 .00 .00 .00 .00 1522.00 FNL 2861.00 FEL
2305.00 .90 93.84 2305.00 24 -.02 24 3.00 .24 93.84 1522.02 FNL 2860.76 FEL
2335.00 1.80 93.84 2334.99 .94 -.06 .94 3.00 .94 93.84 1522.06 FNL 2860.06 FEL
2365.00 2.70 93.84 2364.97 212 -14 2.12 3.00 212 93.84 1522.14 FNL 2858.88 FEL
2395.00 3.60 93.84 2394.92 3.77 -.25 3.76 3.00 3.77 93.84 1522.25 FNL 2857.24 FEL
2425.00 4.50 93.84 2424.85 5.89 -.39 5.87 3.00 5.89 93.84 1522.39 FNL 2855.13 FEL
2455.00 5.40 93.84 2454.73 8.48 -57 8.46 3.00 8.48 93.84 1522.57 FNL 2852.54 FEL
2485.00 6.30 93.84 2484.58 11.53 -77 11.51 3.00 11.53 93.84 1522.77 FNL 2849.49 FEL
2515.00 7.20 93.84 2514.37 15.06 -1.01 15.03 3.00 15.06 93.84 1523.01 FNL 2845.97 FEL
2545.00 8.10 93.84 2544.10 19.05 -1.28 19.01 3.00 19.05 93.84 1523.28 FNL 2841.99 FEL
2575.00 9.00 93.84 25673.77 23.51 -1.58 23.46 3.00 23.51 93.84 1523.58 FNL 2837.54 FEL
2605.00 9.90 93.84 2603.36 28.44 -1.91 28.38 3.00 28.44 93.84 1523.91 FNL 2832.62 FEL

Page 1



Measured Incl Drift True Vertical Dogleg CLOSURE

Depth Angle Direction Vertical Section N-S E-W Severity Distance Direction FNL-FSL FEL-FWL

FT Deg Deg Depth FT FT FT Deg/100 FT Deg FT FT

2635.00 10.80 03.84 2632.87 33.83 -2.27 33.75 3.00 33.83 93.84 1524.27 FNL 2827.25 FEL
2665.00 11.70 93.84 2662.30 39.68 -2.66 39.59 3.00 39.68 03.84 1524.66 FNL 2821.41 FEL
2695.00 12.60 93.84 2691.62 46.00 -3.08 45.89 3.00 46.00 93.84 1525.08 FNL 2815.11 FEL
2725.00 13.50 93.84 2720.85 52.77 -3.54 52.65 3.00 52.77 93.84 1525.54 FNL 2808.35 FEL
2755.00 14.40 93.84 2749.96 60.00 -4.02 59.87 3.00 60.00 93.84 1526.02 FNL 2801.13 FEL
2785.00 15.30 93.84 2778.96 67.69 -4.54 67.54 3.00 67.69 93.84 1526.54 FNL 2793.46 FEL
2815.00 16.20 93.84 2807.83 75.83 -5.08 75.66 3.00 75.83 93.84 1527.08 FNL 2785.34 FEL
2845.00 17.10 93.84 2836.58 84.43 -5.66 84.24 3.00 84.43 93.84 1527.66 FNL 2776.76 FEL
2875.00 18.00 93.84 2865.18 93.48 -6.27 93.26 3.00 93.48 03.84 1528.27 FNL 2767.74 FEL
2905.00 18.90 93.84 2893.64 102.97 -6.90 102.74 3.00 102.97 93.84 1528.90 FNL 2758.26 FEL
2935.00 19.80 93.84 2921.94 112.91 -7.57 112.66 3.00 112.91 93.84 1529.57 FNL 2748.34 FEL
2965.00 20.70 93.84 2950.09 123.29 -8.26 123.02 3.00 123.29 93.84 1530.26 FNL 2737.98 FEL
2995.00 21.60 93.84 2978.07 134.12 -8.99 133.82 3.00 134.12 93.84 1530.99 FNL 2727.18 FEL

End of Build, Begin Hold @ 21.98°, 93.84° Azm
3007.59 21.98 9384 2989.75 138.79 9.30 138.48 3.00 138.79 93.84 1531.30 FNL 2722.52 FEL
3407.59 21.98 93.84 3360.69 288.49 -19.34 287.84 .00 288.49 93.84 1541.34 FNL 2573.16 FEL
3807.59 21.98 93.84 3731.62 438.18 -29.37 437.20 .00 438.18 93.84 1551.37 FNL 2423.80 FEL
4207.59 21.98 93.84 4102.55 587.88 -39.41 586.56 .00 587.88 93.84 1561.41 FNL 2274.44 FEL
4607.59 21.98 93.84 4473.48 737.58 -49.44 735.92 .00 737.58 93.84 1571.44 FNL 2125.08 FEL
5007.59 21.98 93.84 4844.41 887.28 -59.48 885.28 .00 887.28 93.84 1581.48 FNL 1975.72 FEL

Begin Drop @ -3.00°/100'
5375.13 21.98 93.84 5185.25 1024.83 -68.70 1022.52 .00 1024.83 93.84 1590.70 FNL 1838.48 FEL
5405.13 21.08 93.84 5213.15 1035.84 -69.43 1033.51 3.00 1035.84 93.84 1591.43 FNL 1827.49 FEL
5435.13 20.18 93.84 5241.23 1046.41 -70.14 - 1044.05 3.00 1046.41 93.84 1592.14 FNL 1816.95 FEL
5465.13 19.28 93.84 5269.47 1056.53 -70.82 1054.16 3.00 1056.53 93.84 1592.82 FNL 1806.84 FEL
5495.13 18.38 93.84 5297.86 1066.21 -71.47 1063.81 3.00 1066.21 03.84 1593.47 FNL 1797.19 FEL
5525.13 17.48 93.84 5326.41 1075.45 -72.09 1073.03 3.00 1075.45 93.84 1594.09 FNL 1787.97 FEL
5555.13 16.58 93.84 5355.09 1084.23 -72.68 1081.79 3.00 1084.23 93.84 1594.68 FNL 1779.21 FEL
5585.13 15.68 93.84 5383.91 1092.57 -73.24 1090.11 3.00 1092.57 93.84 1595.24 FNL 1770.89 FEL
5615.13 14.78 93.84 5412.86 1100.45 -73.77 1097.97 3.00 1100.45 93.84 1595.77 FNL 1763.03 FEL
5645.13 13.88 93.84 5441.92 1107.87 -74.26 1105.38 3.00 1107.87 93.84 1596.26 FNL 1755.62 FEL
5675.13 12.98 93.84 5471.10 1114.84 -74.73 1112.33 3.00 1114.84 93.84 1596.73 FNL 1748.67 FEL

Page 2
Devil Mesa Unit #1-13 (r1) File: C:\LTSTDSB\TEMP\HARDDR~1\CUSTOM~1\DAVISP~1\Q0706001Q070600.SVY




Measured Incl Drift True Vertical Dogleg CLOSURE

Depth Angle Direction Vertical Section N-S E-W Severity Distance Direction FNL-FSL FEL-FWL

FT Deg Deg Depth FT FT FT Deg/100 FT Deg FT FT

5705.13 12.08 93.84 5500.39 1121.34 -75.17 1118.82 3.00 1121.34 93.84 1597.17 FNL 1742.18 FEL
5735.13 11.18 93.84 5529.77 1127.39 -75.57 1124.85 3.00 1127.39 93.84 1597.57 FNL 1736.15 FEL
5765.13 10.28 93.84 5559.25 1132.97 -75.95 1130.42 3.00 1132.97 93.84 1597.95 FNL 1730.58 FEL
5795.13 9.38 93.84 5588.81 1138.09 -76.29 1135.53 3.00 1138.09 93.84 1598.29 FNL 1725.47 FEL
5825.13 8.48 93.84 5618.44 1142.75 -76.60 1140.18 3.00 1142.75 93.84 1598.60 FNL 1720.82 FEL
5855.13 7.58 93.84 5648.15 1146.94 -76.88 1144.36 3.00 1146.94 93.84 1598.88 FNL 1716.64 FEL
5885.13 6.68 93.84 5677.92 1150.66 -77.13 1148.07 3.00 1150.66 93.84 1599.13 FNL 1712.93 FEL
5915.13 5.78 93.84 5707.74 1153.92 -77.35 1151.32 3.00 1153.92 93.84 1599.35 FNL 1709.68 FEL
5945.13 4.88 93.84 5737.61 1156.70 -77.54 1154.10 3.00 1156.70 93.84 1599.54 FNL 1706.90 FEL
5975.13 3.98 93.84 5767.52 1159.02 -77.69 1156.41 3.00 1159.02 93.84 1599.69 FNL 1704.59 FEL
6005.13 3.08 93.84 5797.46 1160.86 -77.82 1158.25 3.00 1160.86 93.84 1599.82 FNL 1702.75 FEL
6035.13 2.18 93.84 5827.43 1162.24 -77.91 1159.62 3.00 1162.24 93.84 1599.91 FNL 1701.38 FEL
6065.13 1.28 93.84 5857.42 1163.14 -77.97 1160.53 3.00 1163.14 93.84 1599.97 FNL 1700.47 FEL
6095.13 .38 93.84 5887.41 1163.58 -78.00 1160.96 3.00 1163.58 93.84 1600.00 FNL 1700.04 FEL

End of Drop, Hold Vertical to TD
6107.72 .00 93.84 5900.00 1163.62 -78.00 1161.00 3.00 1163.62 93.84 1600.00 FNL 1700.00 FEL
6507.72 .00 93.84 6300.00 1163.62 -78.00 1161.00 .00 1163.62 93.84 1600.00 FNL 1700.00 FEL

PBHL @ 6365' TVD, 6572' MD
6572.72 .00 93.84 6365.00 1163.62 -78.00 1161.00 .00 1163.62 93.84 1600.00 FNL 1700.00 FEL

Page 3
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Baytex Energy
Trust

Devil Mesa Unit #1-13 (r1)

San Juan County, Utah
Q070600

VERTICAL SECTION
SCALE: 1 inch = 750’

VERTICAL SECTION PLANE=93.84°
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Ba ytex En ergy
Trust

C

Devil Mesa Unit #1-13 (r1)
San Juan County, Utah

Q070600

CRITICAL POINTS FOR Devil Mesa Unit #1-13 (r1)
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WinSERVE Map Projection and Magnetics Report

Job Number: Q070600

Company: Baytex Energy Trust
Lease/Well: Devil Mesa Unit #1-13
Location: San Juan County
State/Country: Utah '

Latitude : 37° 39.0000' 36.6480"
Decimal Lat.: 37.66018°

Longitude : -109° 20.0000' 26.9160"
Decimal Long. : -109.34081°
Projection: Utah Central 4302 Lambert
X-Coordinate: 2625395.7431700
Y-Coordinate: -237682.4698793
Zone: - Region:

False Easting: 2000000.00 Ft

False Northing: .00 Ft

Longitude Origin : -111.50

Latitude Origin: 38.33

Ellipsoid Model: Clark - 1866

Map Type and Location: Utah Central 4302
NAD Year: 1927

MAGNETICS

Magnetic Model: C:\WINSERVE\IGRF2005.MIF
Date : 11/16/2007 = 2007.877

Dip Angle : 64.03

Declination : 11.09

Grid Correction (True to Grid): -1.08
Total Correction : 10.01

Field Strength : 51471.72 (nT)

B-X component : 22121.88 (nT)

B-Y component : 4334.56 (nT)

B-Z component : 46272.80 (nT)
B-Horz component : 22542.54 (nT)



STATE OF UTAH FORM 5
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OlL, GAS AND MINING

DESIGNATION OF AGENT OR OPERATOR

The undersigned is, on record, the holder of oil and gas lease

LEASE NAME: Devil Mesa Unit 1-13

LEASE NUMBER: UTU76834

and hereby designates

NAME: Banko Petroleum Management, Inc
ADDRESS: 385 Inverness Parkway, Suite 420
city Englewood state CO zip 80112

as his (check one) agent (3 / operator [0, with full authority to act in his behalf in complying with the terms of the lease and
regulations applicable thereto and on whom the Division Director or Authorized Agent may serve written or oral instructions in
securing compliance with the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules and Procedural Rules of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining
of the State of Utah with respect to:

(Describe acreage to which this designation is applicable. identify each oil and gas well by APl number and name. Aftach additional pages as
needed.)

See attached Application for Permit to Drill (APD), Drilling Program, Surface Use Plan (SUP), and the associated
maps and plats.

It is understood that this designation of agent/operator does not relieve the lessee of responsibility for compliance with the terms
of the lease and the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules and Procedural Rules of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining of the
State of Utah. Itis also understood that this designation of agent or operator does not constitute an assignment of any interest in
the lease.

In case of default on the part of the designated agent/operator, the lessee will make full and prompt compliance with all rules, lease
terms or orders of the Board of Qil, Gas and Mining of the State of Utah or its authorized representative.

The lessee agrees to promptly notify the Division Director or Authorized Agent of any change in this designation.

Effective Date of Designation: N0 VEMPER \1,2001

BY: (Namey _1imothy Morris OF: (Company) BaYtex Energy USA Ltd.
(Signatur?% m — (Address) 600 17th Street, 1900 South
(Title) Vice President i Denver
(Phone) (303) 825-2777 state ©O zip 80202

{5/2000)



(All Drilling Procedures will be followed as Per Onshore Orders No. 1 and No. 2)

This Application for Permit to Drill (APD) is filed under the Notice of Staking (NOS) process as stated in
Onshore Order No. 1 (OSO #1) and supporting Bureau of Land Management (BLM) documents. This NOS
process included on-site meetings on November 8, 2007, prior to the submittal of the application, at which
time the specific concerns of Baytex Energy USA Ltd. (Baytex) and the BLM were discussed. All specific
concerns of the BLM representatives are addressed herein, as are specific stipulations from the BLM.

Please contact Mr. Dave Friesen, Operations Manager, or Mr. Tim Morris, Vice President, at Baytex,

Baytex Energy USA Ltd.

Devil Mesa Unit 1-13

SHL: 1,522’ FNL 2,419’ FWL (SE/4 NW/4) Sec. 13 T36S R23E
BHL: +1,600" FNL +1,700° FEL (SW/4 NE/4) Sec. 13 T36S R23E

San Juan County, Utah

Federal Mineral Lease: UTU76834

DRILLING PROGRAM

303-825-2777, if there are any questions or concerns regarding this Drilling Program.

SURFACE ELEVATION - 6,118’ (Un-graded ground elevation)

SURFACE FORMATION — Morrison - Fresh water possible

1) ESTIMATED FORMATION TOPS (ALL DEPTHS ARE TRUE VERTICAL DEPTH (TVD)

Entrata 780’ Sandstone- possible fresh water

Navajo 1,207° Sandstone- possible fresh water

Wingate 1,634 Sandstone- possible fresh water

Chinle 2,078’ Siltstone, orange,red Shale red, green
Shinarump 2,505 Sandstone, conglomerate possible lost circ.
Cutler 2,932’ poss GAS SHOWS arkosic ss, red shale
Hermosa 4,732’ poss GAS SHOWS arkosic ss, red shale
Upper Ismay 5,895’ PAY- limestone, dolomitic,

Hovenweap sh 6,065’ Shale-black, calcareous

Lower Ismay 6,127’ Anhydrite, limestone, dolomitic

Gothic sh 6,167 Shale-black, calcareous

Desert Creek 6,210° poss PAY-Dolomite, limestone, anhydrite
Chimney Rock sh 6,280’ Shale-black, calcareous

Akah 6,340°

TOTAL DEPTH 6,365 TVD

6,571’ MD



Page 2 . SURFAC!!!SE PLAN OF OPERATIONS
Devil Mesa Unit 1-13

2) ESTIMATED DEPTHS OF ANTICIPATED WATER., OIL, GAS, OR MINERAL BEARING
FORMATIONS

Estimated depths at which water, oil, gas or other mineral-bearing formations are expected to be
encountered:

Entrata 780° Sandstone- possible fresh water
Navajo 1,207° Sandstone- possible fresh water
Wingate 1,634° Sandstone- possible fresh water
Chinle 2,078’ Siltstone, orange,red Shale red, green
Shinarump 2,505 Sandstone, conglomerate possible lost circ.
Cutler 2,932° poss GAS SHOWS arkosic ss, red shale
Hermosa 4,732 poss GAS SHOWS arkosic ss, red shale
Upper Ismay 5,895’ PAY- limestone, dolomitic,
Hovenweap sh 6,065’ Shale-black, calcareous
Lower Ismay 6,127 Anhydrite, limestone, dolomitic
Gothic sh 6,167 Shale-black, calcareous
Desert Creek 6,210° poss PAY-Dolomite, limestone, anhydrite
Chimney Rock sh 6,280° Shale-black, calcareous
Akah 6,340’
TOTAL DEPTH 6,365’ TVD
6,571’ MD

Water bearing zones will be protected with weighted mud. All fresh water encountered during drilling
will be recorded by depth; cased and cemented. All oil and gas shows will be tested to determine
commercial potential.

3) PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT (Minimum Specifications)
Surface Hole; 0-2,175°
A 12-1/4” surface hole will be drilled with water and 8-5/8” casing set.

Production Hole; 2,175°-6,365” TVD (6,571’ MD)
A 7-7/8” hole will be drilled to 6,571° MD and cased with 4-1/2” casing if deemed productive.

BOP systems will be consistent with API RP 53 and will be inspected and operated at least daily to
assure good mechanical working order. The inspection will be recorded on the daily report.
A) Type: Eleven (11) Inch Double Gate Hydraulic BOP mounted on a 3,000 psi casinghead with
an Eleven (11) Inch Annular BOP above.
1) One set of blind rams (above)
2) One set of pipe rams (below)
3) Appropriate fill, kill and choke lines will be 3,000 psi working pressure
B) Auxiliary Equipment:
Auxiliary equipment to include upper kelly cock with handles, a floor safety valve with subs
to fit all drill string connections in use.
C) Pressure Rating: 3,000 psi WP
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D) Testing Procedure:

E)

E)

G)

It is anticipated that a 3M system will be available; however, all testing will comply with
2M standards.
Annular BOP
At a minimum, the annular BOP will be pressure tested to 50% of the rated working pressure of
2,000 psi for a period of ten (10) minutes or until provisions of the test are met, whichever is
longer.
At a minimum, the above pressure test will be performed:

1) When the annular BOP is initially installed.

2) Whenever any seal subject to test pressure is broken.

3) Following related repairs; and

4) At thirty (30) day intervals.
Hydraulic Ram-Type BOP
At a minimum, the BOP, choke manifold, and related equipment will be pressure tested to the
approved working pressure of the BOP stack of 2,000 psi. This pressure will be maintained for
a period of at least ten (10) minutes or until the requirements of the test are met, whichever is
longer.
At a minimum, the above pressure test will be performed:

1) 'When the BOP is initially installed.

2) Whenever any seal subject to test pressure is broken.

3) Following related repairs; and

4) At thirty (30) day intervals
Choke Manifold Equipment:
All choke lines will be straight lines; turns will use tee blocks, or targeted running tees, and will
be anchored to prevent whip and vibration. The manifold will have two (2) chokes, both
remotely controlled from the rig floor, and a pressure gauge.
Accumulator:
The accumulator will have sufficient capacity to open the hydraulically controlled choke line
valve, if so equipped, close all rams plus the annular BOP, and retain a minimum of 200 psi
above pre-charge on the closing manifold without the use of the closing unit pumps. The fluid
reservoir capacity will be double the usable fluid volume of the accumulator system capacity,
and the fluid level of the reservoir will be maintained to the manufacturer’s recommendations.
Miscellaneous Information:
The choke manifold and BOP ram extensions rods with hand wheels will be located outside the
rig substructure. The hydraulic BOP closing unit will be located at least 25’ from the weli
head, but readily accessible to the driller. Exact location and configuration of the hydraulic
BOP closing unit will depend on the layout of the particular rig contracted to drill this well.

A flare line will be installed from the choke manifold to a flare pit, extending a minimum of
125’ from the center of the drill hole.

The BOP and related pressure control equipment will be installed, tested and maintained in
compliance with the specifications and requirements of the Onshore Order No. 2.
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4) PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
A) Casing Program: All new tubulars, manufactured to API specifications.

Purpose Hole Size Csg. Dia. Wt./ft. Grade Joint Depth Set Burst Collapse

Cond. 247 16” -— -~ Weld 0-60* -— -
Surface 12-1/47/11" 8-5/8” 24#  J-55 ST&C 0-2,175 2950 1,370
Prod. 7-7/8”  4-1/27  11.6# J-55 LT&C 0-6,571" 5350 4,960
* Minimum setting depth.
Surface casing string will be pressure tested to 0.22 psi/ft. of casing string length or 1,500 psi,
whichever is greater, but not to exceed 70% of the internal yield strength of the casing; to be
performed after installing BOP stack and prior to drilling out from under the casing shoe.
B) Cementing Program:
Conductor — 6-1/2 cubic yards of ready-mix concrete, if set at 60’ (25% excess).
Surface Casing—  Lead Cement: (Surface to 1,775%) 380 sks, 11.5#/gal , 2.93 ft*/sk Halliburton

San Juan PRB II cement w/ 0.125 Ibm/sk Poly-E-Flake (lost circulation
additive)

Tail Cement (1,775 to 2,175’) 140 sks 13.5 Ib/gal, 1.80 ft*/sk, Halliburton San
Juan PRB II cement w/ 0.125 Tom/sk Poly-E-Flake (lost circulation additive)

Perform Halliburton San Juan PRB II cement w/ 0.125 Ibm/sk Poly-E-Flake
(lost circulation additive) “top job” thru 1” pipe at surface as necessary if
shurry falls back.

Lead and Tail Cement based on 100% excess

Production Casing - Lead Cement: (2,000’ to 5,000°) 345 sks, 11.5#/gal , 2.80 ft’/sk Halliburton
Standard (Class “G”) cement w/ 3% Econolite (Light weight additive),
10 Ibm/sk Gilsonite (Lost circulation additive), 0.25 Ibm/sk Poly-E-Flake
(Lost circulation additive).

Tail Cement (5,000° to 6,541°) 265sks 12.5#/gal , 1.87 ft*/sk Halliburton
50/50 Poz Standard cement with 3% (total) Bentonite (light weight additive),
15% salt (additive material). 0.2% Halad (R ) 344 (Low fluid loss control),
0.2% CFR-3 (Dispersant), 5 Ibm/sk Gilsonite (Lost circulation additive) and
0.125 Ibnvsk Poly-E-Flake (Lost circulation additive)

Top of cement calculated at 2,000’ from surface, or 175’ into surface casing.
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Production cement volume based on 40% excess

The cement volumes are approximate and were calculated under the assumption that a gauge hole will be

achieved. Actual cement volumes may vary due to variations in the actual hole gauge, and will be
determined by running a caliper log in the drilled hole.

5) MUD PROGRAM (visual monitoring)

Interval Mud Type Weight (ppg) Viscosity  Fluid Loss
0-2,175 Fresh Water/Gel 8.3-8.6 27-35 NC
2,175’- 4,700’ Water w/Gel/Lime 8.4-8.6 27-35 10-15
Sweeps
4,700-TD Water/Dispersed 8.89.0 36-40 10

Sufficient mud materials to maintain mud properties, control lost circulation, contain a “gas kick”, and

rebuild an active mud system will be available at the well site during drilling operations. Mud loggers
should be operational by 2,500°.

A closed loop mud system, if available, may be used.

6) TESTING, LOGGING, CORING AND COMPLETION PROGRAM

A. Logs: DIL — GR - SP — Caliper ---—--------~---—- from 6,571’ to Surface Casing,
GR to Surface
FDC -~ CNL - GR from 6,571° to 5,270°
BHC Sonic (possible) —--~-—-=m=-=srn- from 6,571” to Surface Casing
B. Drill Stem Tests: None planned
C. Coring: 50’ of Gothic Shale (6,165’ 6,215’ TVD).
D

. The evaluation program may change at the discretion of the well-site geologist with prior approval
from the Authorized Officer, Monticello Field Office of Bureau of Land Management.

Completion / Stimulation Program:

No stimulation or fracture treatment has been designed for this prospect. The drill site as approved

will be of sufficient size to accommodate any proposed completion activities. The well completion

prognosis will be developed after evaluation of the electric logs and mud log. A sundry notice will

then be filed for approval of the completion program.

f

7) ANTICIPATED BOTTOM HOLE PRESSURE, ABNORMAL TEMPERATURES AND PRESSURES,
OR OTHER HAZARDS

A. Bottom Hole Pressure:

Maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure is 2,812 psi (calculated at 0.43 psi/ft.), and maximum

anticipated surface pressure is 1,372 psi (bottom hole pressure minus the pressure of a partially
evacuated hole calculated at 0.22 psi/ft).




. SURFACgSE PLAN OF OPERATIONS
Devil Mesa Unit 1-13

Page 6

B. Abnormal Temperatures or Pressures:
No abnormal temperatures are anticipated.
No abnormal pressures are anticipated.
C. Potential Hazards:
No Hydrogen Sulfide (H2S) has been encountered or known to exist in any wells drilled to similar
depths in near by wells.

8) ANTICIPATED STARTING DATE AND DURATION
A. Anticipated Starting Date and Duration:
Spud Date: Upon governmental approval and drilling rig availability
Duration of Operations:
1)  Drilling: Approximately 15 days
2)  Completion: Approximately 5 days
B. Drilling Notification:
The spud date will be reported orally to the Authorized Officer of the Bureau of Land Management,
Monticello Field Office, 24 hours prior to spudding, unless otherwise ‘instructed in the site-specific
conditions of approval.
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Devil Mesa Unit 1-13
Surface: 1522' FNL 2,419' FWL ( SE/4 NW /4 )
Sec. 13 T 36S R 23E
BHL: **£1,600' FNL +1,700' FEL Sec. 13 T36S R23E (SW/4 NE/4)
San Juan County, Utah

UTU076834
SURFACE CASING AND CENTRALIZER DESIGN

Proposed True Vettical Depth: 6,365 '
Proposed Depth of Surface Casing: 2,175 "
Estimated Pressure Gradient: 0.43 psif/ft
Bottom Hole Pressure at 6,365 '
0.43 psift x 6,365 = 2,737 psi
Hydrostatic Head of gas/oil mud: 0.22 psifft
0.22 psifft x 6,365" = 1,400 psi
Maximum Design Surface Pressure
Bottom Hole Pressure - Hydrostatic Head =
( 043 psifit x 6,365 ') - ( 022 psifft x 6,365 ') =
2,737  psi - 1,400 psi = 1,337 psi
Casing Strengths 8-5/8" J-55 24# ST&C
Wit. Tension (Ibs) Burst (psi) Collapse (psi)
24 # 244,000 2,950 1,370
32 # 372,000 3,930 2,530
Safety Factors
Tension (Dry): 1.8 Burst: 1.0 Collapse: 1.125
Tension (Dry): 24 #/ft x 2,175 = 52,200 #
Safety Factor = 244,000 = 4,67 ok
52,200
Burst: Safety Factor = 2,950 psi = 2.21 ok
1,337  psi
Collapse: Hydrostatic = 0.052 x 9.0 ppg x 2,175 '= 1,018 psi
Safety Factor = 1,370 psi = 1.35 ok
1,018  psi

Use 2,175"' 8-5/8" J-55 24# ST&C

Use 2,000 psi minimum casinghead and BOP's

Centralizers 5 Total

1 near surface at 160’
2 -1 each at middle of bottom joint, second joint, third joint
2 -1 each at every other join  +80 ' spacing

Total centralized = 400 '( 1,775 — 2,175 ")

Note that field experience indicates that additional centralizers greatly increase the chance
of "sticking" the surface casing prior to reaching surface casing total depth.



WInSERVE Map Projection and Magnetics Report

Job Number: Q070600

Company: Baytex Energy Trust
Lease/Well: Devil Mesa Unit #1-13
Location: San Juan County
State/Country: Utah

Latitude : 37° 39.0000' 36.6480"
Decimal Lat.: 37.66018°

Longitude : -109° 20.0000' 26.9160"
Decimal Long. : -109.34081°
Projection: Utah Central 4302 Lambert
X-Coordinate: 2625395.7431700
Y-Coordinate: -237682.4698793
Zone: - Region:

False Easting: 2000000.00 Ft

False Northing: .00 Ft

Longitude Origin : -111.50

Latitude Origin: 38.33

Ellipsoid Model: Clark - 1866

Map Type and Location: Utah Central 4302
NAD Year: 1927

MAGNETICS

Magnetic Model: C:\WINSERVE\IGRF2005.MIF
Date : 11/16/2007 = 2007.877

Dip Angle : 64.03

Declination : 11.09

Grid Correction (True to Grid): -1.08
Total Correction : 10.01

Field Strength : 51471.72 (nT)

B-X component : 22121.88 (nT)

B-Y component : 4334.56 (nT)

B-Z component : 46272.80 (nT)
B-Horz component : 22542.54 (nT)



DAVIS PETROLEUM CORP.

DEVIL MESA UNIT AREA
SAN JUAN COUNTY, UT
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MINIMUM

BOP Requirements

3000 PSIW.P.
FILL LINE ABOVE THE UPPERMOST PREVENTER

HYDRIL 10" 3000 PSI W.P.

RAM 10" 3000 PSI W.P.

@ SCREWED
RAM 10" 3000 PSI W.P CONNECTIONS

: BEYOND THIS
/ POINT

ADJUSTABLE CHOKI%_CQ 2" MIN g
rLow @

To mud/gas
separator
and/or pit

CASING HEAD - 3000 PSI W.P. To mud/gas
separator
ADJUSTABLE CHOKE ' 2" MIN and/or pit
KILL LINE CHOKE LINE
Valve#1 — Flanged check valve Valves #4 & 5 — Flanged minimum 3" bore

Full working pressure of BOP
Full working pressure of BOP

Valve #2 — Flanged, minimum 2" bore

Full working pressure of BOP (Note: An HCR can be used

instead of Valve # 5)

GENERAL RULES AND RECOMMENDATIONS

All lines to manifold are to be at right angles (90 deg.). No 45 deg. angles are to be used.
Blind flanges are to be used for blanking.
All studs and nuts are to be installed on all flanges.



WORKSHEET

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 11/29/2007

API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-037-31879

WELIL NAME: DEVIL MESA U 1-13
OPERATOR: BAYTEX ENERGY (USA) LTD ( N3305 ) PHONE NUMBER: 303-825-2777
CONTACT: DAVID BANKO
PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
SENW. 13 3605 230E Tech Review Initials Date
SURFACE: 1522 FNL 2419 FWL
g@“ie BOTTOM: 1600 FNL 1700 FEL Engineering
COUNTY: SAN JUAN Geology
LATITUDE: 37.66030 LONGITUDE: -109.3400
UTM SURF EASTINGS: 646419 NORTHINGS: 4169216 Surface
FIELD NAME: UNDESIGNATED ( 2 )
LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal
LEASE NUMRBRER: UTU076834 PROPOSED FORMATION: DSCR
SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal COALBED METHANE WELL? NO
RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:
_ Plat R649-2-3. oy yé\%)ﬂ‘
v Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Stal[] Feell Unit: DEVIL MESA Q&ﬁy
(No. UTB-000293 )
IL( Potash (Y/N) R649-3-2. General
ﬂf 0il Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting: 460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells
v~ Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception

(No. 09-413 )
A RDCC Review (Y/N)

{Date: )
_Eﬂi_ Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N)
MA  Intent to Commingle (Y/N)

Drilling Unit
Board Cause No:
Eff Date:
Siting:

\/ R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:

STIPULATIONS:

|- Qmﬂwrmﬁ

1 f
¢ AQ,m CiL(i &mﬂ'
J




LNR B

13-14

T36S R23E

EAST MUSTANG
B-11 ¢

BIG PONY 1-13
&

DEVIL MESA U
3 &—— GBHL

113

13

DEVIL MESA UNIT

T36S R24E

DIABLO 1
o

18

STANG FLAT HELD

LITTLE PONY
23-32
LITTLE PONY
23-32

24

OPERATOR: BAYTEX ENERGY USA (N3305)

SEC: 13 T.36S

COUNTY: SAN JUAN

FIELD: UNDESIGNATED (002)

SPACING: R649-3-11 / DIRECTIONAL DRILLING

Wells Status

Field Status
] ABANDONED
] ACTIVE
COMBINED

1 INACTIVE
{1 PROPOSED

' STORAGE
] TERMINATED

Unit Status
[JEXPLORATORY
GAS STORAGE
NF PP OIL
NF SECONDARY
[ ]PENDING
[ PIOIL
PP GAS
PP GEOTHERML
[rpOIL
] SECONDARY
[ TERMINATED

;f
R
X
$
I+
-
X
O
ol
%
®

GAS INJECTION

GAS STORAGE
LOCATION ABANDONED
NEW LOCATION
PLUGGED & ABANDONED
PRODUCING GAS
PRODUCING OIL
SHUT-IN GAS

SHUT-IN OIL

TEMP. ABANDONED
TEST WELL

WATER INJECTION
WATER SUPPLY

WATER DISPOSAL
DRILLING

UTAH

DNR
]

OIL, GAS & MINING

N

S
PREPARED BY: DIANA MASON
DATE: 18-DECEMBER-2007
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United States Department of the Interior m-
B

BURFAU OF LAND MANAGEMFNT TAKE PRIDE

Utah State Office INAMERICA

P.0. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
http://www.blm.gon

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
UT-922

December 12, 2007

Baytex Energy USA Ltd.

¢/o UnitSource Incorporated
P. O. Box 2047

Sheridan, WY 82801

Gentlemen:

The Devil Mesa Unit Agreement, San Juan County, Utah was approved on December 12, 2007.
This agreement has been designated No. UTU85849X and is effective December 12, 2007. A
copy of the agreement is enclosed.

This unit provides for the drilling of one obligation well and subsequent drilling obligations
pursuant to Section 9 of the unit agreement. The surface location of the well is in the NWY4 of
Section 13, Township 36 South, Range 23 East, SLM&B, San Juan County, Utah. The bottom
hole location will be in the NEY of Section 13. The total depth of the well will be 6,365 feet, or
to test 260 feet below the base of the Upper Ismay Zone of Ithe Pardox formation, whichever is
less. No extension of time beyond June 12, 2008, will be granted to commence the "obligation
well" other than "unavoidable delay" (Section 25), where justified.

Approval of this agreement does not warrant or cerify that the operator thereof and other
holders of operating rights hold legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject leases which
are committed hereto.
The basic information is as follows:
1. The depth of the test well and the area to be unitized were approved under the unit plan
regulations of December 22, 1950, by Bureau of Land Management letter dated
November 27, 2007.

2. All formations are unitized.

3. The unit area embraces 1,893.05 acres, more or less, of which 1.893.05 acres (100
percent) are Federal lands.



The following leases embrace lands included within the unit area:

UTU76834 *UTu76840

* Indicates lease to be segregated.

All lands and interests are fully/effectively committed. All parties owning interests within
this unit area were invited to join the unit agreement.

In view of the foregoing commitment status, effective control of operations within the unit area is
assured. We are of the opinion that the agreement is necessary and advisable in the public
interest and for the purpose of more properly conserving natural resources.

Sincerely,

ey A Fammand

Becky J. Hammond
Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure
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PETROLEUM
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FEDERAL EXPRESS — Standard Overnight

Ms. Diana Whitney December 17, 2007
Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

1594 W. North Temple, Suite 1210

Salt Lake City, UT 84116

RE:  Notification of Directional Drilling
Application for Permit to Drill — Directional Drill
Baytex Energy USA Ltd.
Devil Mesa Unit 1-13
SHL: 1,522° FNL 2,419’ FWL (SE/4 NW/4) Sec. 13 T36S R23E
BHL: +1,600° FNL =1,700° FEL (SW/4 NE/4) Sec. 13 T36S R23E
San Juan County, Utah
Federal Mineral Lease: UTU76834

We herewith notify you of Directional Drilling for the above proposed well, per Utah Division of Qil, Gas,
and Mining (UDOGM) R649-3-11. The well is located as shown in order to be acceptable geologically,
topographically, and legally. The wellsite lies within the Devil Mesa Unit boundary UTU85849X.

The proposed True Vertical Depth of 6,365" and the target producing formation is the Upper Ismay and
Desert Creek/Chimney Rock shale at 6,365’ TVD; 6,571 MD. The well bottomhole will be located
+1,163.6" southeast of the surface locations at the Upper Ismay, Desert Creek/Chimney Rock shale, and
Akah and at total depth.

This filing contains the following attachments: directional profile, survey plats, and lease unit map.

Please address any questions or comments to the undersigned at 303-820-4480 or at david@bankol.com.
Thank you for your assistance.

Very truly yours,

G e 7

David F. Banko
Permit Agent for Baytex Energy USA Ltd.

DFB:jmg
cc: Baytex Energy USA Ltd.

Davis Petroleum Corp.
Dana Consultants — Keith Dana

385 Inverness Parkway, Suite 420 * Englewood, CO 80112-5849 » USA « 303.820.4480 » Fax 303.820.4124
E-mail: david@bankol.com * Home site: www.banko1.com
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orm - : FORM APPROVED
(FAugu:Z&a"/) REG ﬂ v ;{{{) FEICE OMB No. 1004-0137
HORTICELLO {RED D STATES Expires July 31, 2010
T Nﬁ quTHE INTERIOR 5. Lease Seriat No.
07 @EQEU '\g% LAND MANAGEMENT UTU076834
N TR 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

WIQN FOR;PE”RMﬁ? 7O DRILL OR REENTER -

7. If Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.
1a. Type of work: |X|DR||_L DREENTER Devil Mesa Unit  UTU-085849X

8. Lease Name and Well No.

1b. Type of Well I:, Oil Well Gas Well I:lother IESingle Zone DMultiple Zone Devil Mesa Unit 1-13

APPLf%

2. Name of Operator E-mail: tim.morris@baytexenergyusa.cofe. APi Well No.
Baytex Energy USA Ltd. Contact: Tim Morris 4 . .
3a. Address 600 17th Street, Suite 1900 South 3b. Phone No. (include area code)  |10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
Denver CO 80202 303-825-2777 Wildcat
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State Requirements.*) 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk. and Survey or Area
At surface 15622' FNL 2,419' FWL SE /4 Nw /4
Sec. 13 T36S R23E
Lat: 37.66018N Long: 109.34081W
At proposed production zone **+1,600" FNL £1,700' FEL Sec. 13 T36S R23E (SW/4 NE/4) Meridian: S.L.M.
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office. * 12, County or parish 13, State
8 miles northeast of Blanding, UT San Juan Utah
15. Distance from proposed location to nearest  Upit= ~ +2,419' 16. No. of acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit dedicated to this well
property or iease line, ft. (Also nearest Drig, unit
fine, i any) Lease= +2 435 960.0 160
18. Distance from proposed location* E Mustang 13-11 19. Proposed depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file
to nearest well, drilling, completed or applied . .
for, on this lease, ft. +1,775 6,365 TVD Applied for
21, Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) ‘ 22, Approximate date work will start * 23. Estimated duration
6,118 'GR Upon Approval 30-45 days drlg + completion
24. Attachments
The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:
1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond
2. A Drilling Plan. ) on file (see item 20 above).
3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest 5. Operator certification.
System Lands, the SUPO must be filed with the appropriate 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be
Forest Service Office). required by the BLM.
T s o 7?—‘ Name (Pried/Typed) "Date
/ / 2 :David F. Banko 303-820-4480 . November 27, 2007
Title
Permit Agent for: Baytex Energy USA Ltd.
Approved by (Signature) yName (Prinfed/Typed) 1Date
RREE P s e : 12013 Iy
Title ~ ; \[',\..nq 1Office . .
As it Vel oh : Division of Resources

.o i P . Q H
Application appﬁ; gﬂ@ ’;ﬁ ﬁﬁi o’ ce%l% tEat tHe applicant holds legal or equitable fitle to those rlgh@ Hﬁé‘éu&é& ‘éésé"v&ﬁfc‘ﬂ V/ould entitle the applicant to conduct operations

thereon.
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached.

Title 18 U.8.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false,
fictitious, or fraudulent statements or representations as fo any matter within its jurisdiction.

(continued on page 2) *(Instructions on page 3)
A W4
RECEIVED

DEC 18 Z00CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL ATTACHED
D'V OF OIL, GAS & MikING
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SOUTH, 80 Chains (5280 Feet) From GLO Plat

SCALE : 1" =1000

o 500 1000

(O Well location
'@ JFound 1912 GLO Monument

— Proposed well pad

- = Protracted lines

S 76°58'03" E
381.60°

Ref Point
Elov. 6124.8

SCALE : 1°" =200
WELL LOCATION: 200
Ground Elev. 6118 feet.

,Finished Grade 6119 feet. E

Rev. November 1, 2007 0 100 200

NOTES

: N GR49' E, 80.22 Chains  (5292.52 Feet) From Gl.wt
' : N 89 "E T A
, N 1/4 COR SEC 13
NW Cor Sec. 1, S:if: a) - / NE Cor Sec. 13
No Monument | No Monument
» Found Found
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<
L
P E 1/4 Cor Sec. 13
& : No Monument Found
< N
go—--—--—— e —
§ w144 cor ' DAVIS PETROLEUM CORP.
8| DEVIL MESA UNIT 1-13
E 1 Section 13, T.36S., R.23E.,
5 ! S.LM.,
8 |w San Juan County, Utah
z to:“zo% }
58 8
SNz
n Elevation Derived From 1
GPS Observations: 6230' |
. (Devll Mesa, Utah,
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1) Bearings are based on GPS observations.
2) Surface ownership — Public Lands

3) Elevations are based on GPS observations post
processed with OPUS

4) Surface area:Pinion — Juniper

5) Initiol field survey: October 24, 2007.

6) No visible improvements within 200° of site.

7) Well locations based on GPS observations
Lat. 37.66018N Long. 109.34081W
UTM 4169203.6N, 646411.7E NAD 27 Zone 12

8) GPS receivers set to exclude PDOP values over 6.

by these presents :

Geareld Hudeiston, do hereby certify thot | prepared this
R actual and accurate survey of the Land and that the
and correct to the best of my knowledge and belief.

\ NESS & Associates Inc.

REGISTERED LAND SLRVEYORS

28 S. Washington -

—TENS oA

P.O. Box 1163 -~

Cortez, CO. 81321

Phone: 970/565-8845




Baytex Energy USA Ltd.

Devil Mesa Unit 1-13

Lease UTU-76834

Devil Mesa Unit

SE/NW Section 13, T36S, R23E (surface)
SW/NE Section 13, T36S, R23E (bottom hole)
San Juan County, Utah

A COMPLETE COPY OF THIS APPROVED PERMIT AND CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
shall be maintained on location during all construction and drilling operations, and shall
be available to contractors to ensure compliance.

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

Approval of this application does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title
to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Be advised that Baytex Energy USA Ltd. is considered to be the operator of the above well and is -
responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease for the operations conducted on the leased
lands.

Bond coverage for this well is provided by UTB000293 (Principal - Baytex Energy USA Ltd.) via
surety consent as provided for in 43 CFR 3104.2.

This office will hold the aforementioned operator and bond liable until the provisions of 43 CFR
3106.7-2 continuing responsibility are met.

This permit will be valid for a period of two years from the date of approval. After permit termination,
a new application must be filed for approval.

All lease operations will be conducted in full compliance with applicable regulations (43 CFR
3100), Onshore Oil and Gas Orders, lease terms, notices to lessees, and the approved plan of
operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. Failure to
comply with the provisions of this permit, including applicable regulations, stipulations, and/or
approval conditions, will be considered a violation subject to the enforcement provisions of 43
CFR Subpart 3163.

A. DRILLING PROGRAM

1. Concurrent approval from the State of Utah, Division of Oil, Gas & Mining (DOGM) is
required before conducting any surface disturbing activities.

2. The proposed well control equipment is appropriate for anticipated conditions. Well
control equipment for the production section of the well shall meet or exceed 2M
standards. Installation, testing and operation of the system shall be in conformance
with Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2.

3. Drilling reports, which describe the activities of each day, shall be submitted to
the BLM Moab Field Office on a weekly, or more frequent, basis. In addition to a
daily summary of activities, drilling reports shall include the drilling fluid weight,
details of casing and cement, water flows, lost circulation zones and any other
information that would contribute to our understanding of drilling conditions.



B. SURFACE

No additional surface use conditions of approval.



C. REQUIRED APPROVALS, REPORTS AND NOTIFICATIONS

Required verbal notifications are summarized in Table 1, attached.

Building Location- Contact the BLM Natural Resource Protection Specialist at least 48-hours prior to
commencing construction of location.

Spud- The spud date will be repoﬁed to BLM 24-hours prior to spud. Written notification in the form
of a Sundry Notice (Form 3160-5) will be submitted to the Moab Field Office within 24-hours after
spud, regardless of whether spud was made with a dry hole digger or big rig.

Daily Drilling Reports- Daily drilling reports shall detail the progress and status of the well and shall
be submitted to the Moab Field Office on a weekly basis.

Oil and Gas Operations Reports (OGORs)- Production from this well shall be reported to
Minerals Management Service (MMS) on a monthly basis.

Sundry Notices- There will be no deviation from the proposed drilling and/or workover program
without prior approval. "Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells" (Form 3160-5) will be filed, with the
Moab Field Office, for approval of all changes of plans and subsequent operations in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.3-2. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed.

Drilling Suspensions- Operations authorized by this permit shall not be suspended for more than 30
days without prior approval of the Moab Field Office. All conditions of this approval shall be
applicable during any operations conducted with a replacement rig.

Undesirable Events- Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents, or any other unusual occurrences shall
be immediately reported to the BLM in accordance with requirements of NTL-3A.

Cultural Resources- If cultural resources are discovered during construction, work that might disturb
the resources is to stop, and the Monticello Field Office is to be notified.

First Production- Should the well be successfully completed for production, the Moab Field Office
will be notified when the well is placed in producing status. Such notification may be made by
phone, but must be followed by a sundry notice or letter not later than five business days following
the date on which the well is placed into production.

A first production conference will be scheduled through the Monticello Field Office as soon as the
productivity of the well is apparent.

Well Completion Report- Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log" (Form 31 60-4) will be submitted to the Moab Field
Office not later than thirty-days after completion of the well or after completion of operations being
performed, in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-1. Two copies of all logs, core descriptions, core
analyses, well test data, geologic summaries, sample description, and all other surveys or data
obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover, and/or completion operations, will be filed with
Form 3160-4. When requested, samples (cuttings and/or samples) will be submitted to the Moab
Field Office.




Venting/Flaring of Gas- Gas produced from this well may not be vented/flared beyond an initial,
authorized test period of 30 days or 50 MMcf, whichever first occurs, without the prior, written
approval of the Moab Field Office. Should gas be vented or flared without approval beyond the
authorized test period, the well may be ordered shut-in until the gas can be captured or approval to
continue the venting/flaring as uneconomic is granted. In such case, compensation to the lessor
shall be required for that portion of the gas that is vented/flared without approval and which is
determined to have been avoidably lost.

Produced Water- Produced waste water may be confined to an unlined pit for a period not to exceed
90 days after initial production. During the 90 day period, an application for approval of a permanent
disposal method and location, along with the required water analysis, will be submitted to the Moab
Field Office for approval pursuant to Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 7.

Off-Lease Measurement, Storage, Commingling- Prior approval must be obtained from the Moab
Field Office for off-lease measurement, off-lease storage and/or commingling (either down-hole or at
the surface).

Plugging and Abandonment- If the well is completed as a dry hole, plugging instructions must be
obtained from the Moab Field Office prior to initiating plugging operations.

A "Subsequent Report of Abandonment" (Form 3160-5) will be filed with the Moab Field Office within
thirty-days following completion of the well for abandonment. This report will indicate where plugs
were placed and the current status of surface restoration. Upon completion of approved plugging, a
regulation marker will be erected in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.6. Final abandonment will be
approved when the Monticello Field Office determines that surface reclamation work has
successfully restored desirable vegetation.

TABLE 1 NOTIFICATIONS

Notify Jeff Brown (435-587-1525) of the BLM, Monticello Field Office for the following:
2 days prior to commencement of dirt work, construction and reclamation;
1 day prior to spud;
3 hours prior to testing BOP

If the person at the above number cannot be reached, notify the Moab Field Office at 435-259-2100.
If unsuccessful, contact the person listed below.

Well abandonment operations require 24 hour advance notice and prior approval. In the case of
newly drilled dry holes, verbal approval can be obtained by calling the Moab Field Office at
435-259-2100. If approval is needed after work hours, you may contact:

Eric Jones, Petroleum Engineer Office: (435) 259-2117
Home: (435) 259-2214
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RATIFICATION AND JOINDER OF UNIT AGREEMENT
AND
UNIT OPERATING AGREEMENT

In consideration of the execution of the Unit Agreement for the Development and Operation of the Devil Mesa Unit
Area, County of San Juan, State of Utah, dated _NQY 27 » 2007, in form approved on behalf of the Secretary of the

Interior, and in consideration of the execution or ratification by other Working, Im,e;egt Owners of the Unit Operating

Agreement, Devil Mesa Unit Area, County of San Juan, State of Utah, dated NU_" <7 » 2007, the undersigned

working interest owner hereby expressly ratifies, approves, and adopts said Unit Agreement, and also said Unit Operating
Agreement as fully as though the undersigned had executed the original agreements.

This Ratification and Joinder shall be effective as to the undersigned's interests in any lands and leases, or interests
therein. and royalties presently held or which may arise under existing option agreements or other interests in unttized
substances. covering the lands within the Unit Area in which the undersigned may be found to have an oil or gas interest.

This Ratification and Joinder shall be binding upon the undersigned. its successors and assigns.
/

v

EXECUTED this 4 day of juidipds | 2007

o~

s Ay - /
w‘;’ﬁfz ’—1‘2/4;' /%{Z\/-J

Prank Yates, Jf.as Attg By=in-Fact

Address:  Yates Petroleum Corporation

Artesia, NM 88210

CORPORATE ACKNOWLEDGMENT

STATE OF _New Mexico )
) ss.
COUNTY OF _ Eddv )

The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me by pyank Yates, Jr.

as _Attorney=-in-Fact of Yates Petroleum Corporation
i
This “"" dayof { (e bt 2007,

WITNESS my hand and official seal.

My Commission Expires: : ,
pasebowle M el
T OFFCIAL S, Soars Pobiic

W Wetinda Natividac ]

j: NOTARY BUBLIC-SYATE OF NEW MEXCO

& g
My commission expires:-z )




EXHBYT "B

SCHEDULE SHOWING THE PERCENTAG
DEVH, MESA UNIT AREA

SAN JUAN COUNTY, UTAH

E AND KIND OF OWNERSHIP OF OIL AND GAS INTERESTS

< REST
RACT NUMBER SERIAL NUMBER BASIC ROVALTY LESSEE OF RECORD OVERRIDING ROYALTY WORKleNlli)VTE ES
NA(‘)C ' DESCRIPTION OF & EXPIRATION AND AND AND PERCENTAGE
- OF LAND ACRES DATE OF LEASE PERCENTAGE PERCENTAGE PERCENTAGE ERC
I FEDERAL L.ANDS: I
. i 100%
T§6 SR23ESELM 960.00 U-76834 U.S.A. - All (12.5% royalty) Yates Pctrolewn Corporation 100% None Yates Petroteum Corporation "
SEC 12 W2, sk/q
SEC 13 N2, N/28/2 Effective
1/1/1998
Expires
123112607
. g i 100%;
2. ;himm 933.06 U-76840 U.S.A. - Al (12.5% royalty) Yates Petroleum Corporation 100% None Yates Petroleum Corporation
SECT Lots 3, 4, E/2SW/d4, SE/4
SECI8 Lots 1, 2,3, 4, E/2, £22W/2 (AL1) Effective
11171998
Expires
12/31/2007
T — — ®
FEDERAL TRACTS 1.893.06 ACRES OR 100.00% OF UNIT AREA
L M_‘\_‘_‘_%_A__h____‘__ e e
1171202007

DEVIL MESA UNIT AREA Page?



Stat&@f Utah o

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAELR. STYLER
Executive Director

: o
., I & ”
e lront?

Division of Oil Gas and Mining
JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR, -

Governor JOHN R. BAZA

Division Director
GARY R. HERBERT

Lieutenant Governor

December 20, 2007

Baytex Energy USA Ltd.
600 17th St., Ste. 1900 South
Denver, CO 80202

Re; Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 Well, Surface Location 1522' FNL, 2419’ FWL, SE NW, Sec. 13,
T. 36 South, R. 23 West, Bottom Location 1600' FNL, 1700' FEL . SW NE, Sec. 13.
T. 36 South, R. 23 East. San Juan County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 ef seq., Utah
Administrative Code R649-3-1 ef seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous
operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date. The API
identification number assigned to this well is 43-037-31879.

Sincerely,
Z~ Gil Hunt
Associate Director
pab
Enclosures
cc: San Juan County Assessor

Bureau of Land Management, Moab Office

UTAH

DNR
1

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 « facsimile (801) 359-3940 « TTY (801) 538-7458 « www.ogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS & MINING



Operator: Baytex Energy USA 1.td.

Well Name & Number Devil Mesa Unit 1-13

API Number: 43-037-31879

Lease: UTU076834

Surface Location: SENW Sec. 1 T. 36 South R. 23 West
Bottom Location: SW NE Sec. 13 T. 36 South R. 23 East

o

(OS]

R

o

Conditions of Approval

. General

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

. Notification Requirements

Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
. Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
. Contact Dustin Doucet at (801) 538-5281  (801) 733-0983 home

. Reporting Requirements

All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be

obtained prior to drilling.

In accordance with Utah Admin. R.649-3-11, Directional Drilling, the operator shall submit

a complete angular deviation and directional survey report to the Division within 30 days
following completion of the well.

This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have

not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the “Board”).
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as 1s practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.



State o: Utah

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAELR. STYLER
Executive Director

Division of Oil Gas and Mining
JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
Governor JOHN R. BAZA
Division Director
GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

December 20, 2007
Corrected January 3, 2008

Baytex Energy USA Ltd.
600 17th St., Ste. 1900 South
Denver, CO 80202

Re: Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 Well, Surface Location 1522' FNL, 2419' FWL, SE NW. Sec. 13,
1. 36 South, R. 23 East, Bottom Location 1600' FNL, 1700' FEL, SW NE, Sec. 13,
T. 36 South, R. 23 East, San Juan County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 ef seg., Utah
Administrative Code R649-3-1 ef seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous
operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date. The API
identification number assigned to this well is 43-037-31879.

Sincerely,

Gil Hunt
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: San Juan County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Moab Office

UTAH

DNR
1

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801 prprrrppr—
telephone (801) 538-5340 + facsimile (801) 359-3940 « TTY (801) 538-7458 « www.ogm.utah.gov



Operator: Baytex Energy USA Ltd.

Well Name & Number Devil Mesa Unit 1-13

API Number: 43-037-31879

Lease: UTUO076834

Surface Location: SE NW . 13 T. 36 South R. 23 East
Bottom Location: SW NE c. | T. 36 South R. 23 East

—_—

. General

Conditions of Approval

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rulcs, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved

Application for permit to drill.

o

Notification Requirements

Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
) Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.

. Contact Dustin Doucet at (801) 538-5281

L]

. Reporting Requirements

(801) 733-0983 home

All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

s

State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5 In accordance with Utah Admin. R.649-3-11, Directional Drilling, the operator shall submit
a complete angular deviation and directional survey report to the Division within 30 days

following completion of the well.

o

This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have

not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the “Board").
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU 076834 ’
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS & 7 INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

his f f | drili |l ficantly d 1 lls bel t b hole depth, ter pl d well 7o UNIT or GA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drili new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to . f '
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals, Devil Mesa Unit UTU-085849X

5 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
oL weLL [ GAS WELL OTHER Devil Mesa Unit 1-13

1. TYPE OF WELL

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Baytex Energy USA Ltd 4303731879
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
600 17th Street Suite 1900 ... Denver srare CO 580202 (303) 825-2777 WM onderenaled
-4, LOCATION OF WELL "
‘ f FOOTAGES AT sURFACE: 1522' FNL 2419' FWL SE/4 NW/4 county: San Juan
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SE/‘( Hu/&( see. (LS TS gZSE STATE:
UTAH
1", CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION ‘ TYPE OF ACTION
m NOTICE OF INTENT I:] ACIDIZE D DEEPEN |—_—| REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION '
(Submit in Duplicate) ] ALTER CASING [] rrACTURE TREAT [[] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: D CASING REPAIR D NEW CONSTRUCTION D TEMPORARILY ABANDON
2/28/2008 [[] cHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS ] oPERATOR CHANGE [] tusiNG RepPAR
[C] cHance TuBING ] PLuc AND ABANDON [] venTorFLARE
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT I:] CHANGE WELL NAME D PLUG BACK D WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Criginal Form Only) '
Date of ‘ ot |:] CHANGE WELL STATUS D PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) D WATER SHUT-OFF
€ OF Work completien.
: P [[] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE ] otrer:
D CONVERT WELL TYPE D RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION
12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, étc.
Propose to change the conductor size, grade, setting depth, hole size and cement volume.
FROM:
Purpose Hole Size CsgDia wt/ft Grade Joint Depth Set Burst Collapse
Conductor 24" 16" - - weld 0-60' - -
Cement with 6 1/2 cubic yards ready-mix concrete, if set at 60" (2 5% excess) . Accepted by the
o Utah Division of
To: Oil, Gas and Minin
‘Purpose Hole Size ng Dia wt/ft Grade Joint Depth Set Burst Collapse 3o g
Conductor 17 1/2" 133/8" 48 H-40 ST&C 0-70' 1750 750 SR eI « |
Cement with 7 1/2 cubic yards ready-mix concrete, if set at 70' (25% excess) FOQ HECOHD ONLY
nave (pLease privry_David Friesen ' mme  Manager Drilling and Completions
SIGNATURE * ‘ DATE 1/4/2008

/

(This space for State ﬁm}

GAS &“\“\“G (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

(6/2000)



FORM APPROVED

(}/I:Eu%st] ‘33“5? . ) UNITED STATES OMB No. 1004-0137
- DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires: July 31, 2010
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.
UTU 076834
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. 1f Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an -
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE — Other instructions on page 2. 7.AFUnit of CA/Agrecment, Name and/or Ne.

e Devil Mesa Unit UTU-085848X
1. Type of Well

Ny o : 8. Well Name and No.

Clonwen  [] Gas well [ other Devil Mesa Unit 1-13
2. Name of Operator 9. APl Well No.
Baytex Energy YSA Lid 4303731879
Ja, Address 3b. Phone No. finchude area code) 10. Field and Pool or Exploratory Asea
600 17th Street, Suite 1500, Denver, Co. B0202 (303) 825-2777 Undesignated
4. Location of Well g-'ooia ¢, Sec., T, R, M., or Survey Description) 1. Country or Parish, State
1522 FNL, 2419 FWL, § . Sec 13, Th68, RI3E

8an Juan, Utah

12. CHECK THE APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[Z} Notice of Intent c:] Acidize E] Deepen D Production (Start/Resume} D Water Shut-Off
D Alter Casing D Fracture Treat D Reclamation D Well Integrity
[ ] Casing Repair D New Construction E:] Recomplete I:] Other Elgwticg of Spud .
[:I Subsequent Report e S
DC‘hange Plans D Plug and Abandon D Temporarily Abandon e
D Final Abandonment Notice D Convert to Injection [:] Plug Back m Water Disposal o

13, Describe Proposed or Completed Operation: Clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof. If
the proposal is to déepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond underwhich the work will bs performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA, Reqmred subsequent reports must be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. 1f the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 must be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices must be filed only after all requirements, including rectamation, have been completed and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

24 kour prior notice of spud,

Rig move of Patterson-UT} Rig 749 scheduled for May 5, 2008.
Date plan to spud May 6, 2008
Verbal notification to Jeff Brown May 2, 2008 0900H,

Conductor pre-set with Bob Beeman Drilling Co on April 29, 2008, set and cemented 70" GL of 14" conductor.
Proposed total depth of well: 6365° TVD /6571 MD
BOPE Rating: 3M

RECEIVED
MAY 02 2008

Baytex field drilling supervisor: Terry Blacquier (403} 548-5570

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
4. 1 hereby centify that the foregoing 1s true and correct. Name (Privted/Typed)
B ped 0L FRAIETE R _ Tile  bAaoys e ey i e, ¢ fealispons,
Signature | A : . Date  ghae, 2, 2o0d
o \5: \) THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE
Approved ;;y
.............................................................................. Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice docs not warrant or certify
that the-applicant holds legal of equitable title to those rights in the subject fease which would  [Office
entitie the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Titke 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfuily to make to any department or agency of the United Stites any false,
fictiious or fraudulent statements OF representations as 0 any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Insteuctions on page 2)



BAYTEX

ENERGY USA LTD

February i, 2008

Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Re: Weii  Devil Mesa 1-13
API# 43-037-31879

Gentlemen

Please find attached our Sundry Notice (in triplicate). It is our intent to change the BOP
configuration from a 10” X 3000 PSI WP stack using a Hydril annular preventer as the top
component. We would propose and seek approval to instead use an 11” X 3000 PSI WP stack
with an RBOP as the top component. This is due to sub structure height restrictions and the
proposed configuration in standard rig inventory of our contracted rig from Patterson-UTI.

Should you have any questions or concerns pleasevfeel free to contact the undersigned at (403)
750-1243. , :

Sincerely,

David Friesen

Baytex Energy USA Ltd
Manager, Drilling and completions
Main (303) 825-2777

Fax  (303) 825-2790

Direct (403) 750-1243

Cell  (403) 803-9038

RECEIVED
MAR 03 2008

pIv. OF OlL, GAS & MINING

600 Scventcenth Strect | Telephone 303.825.2777
Suite 1900 South Facsimile 303.825.2790
Denver, CO 80202 www.baytex.ab.ca



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5, LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU 076834

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

8. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Devil Mesa Unit UTU-085849X

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

1. TYPE OF WELL
oLwelL [J  caswell /] OTHER Devil Mesa Unit 1-13
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APl NUMBER:
Baytex Energy USA Ltd 4303731879
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
600 17th Street Suite 1900 ., Denver stare GO 80202 (303) 825-2777 Undesignated

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 1522' FNL 2419' FWL SE/4 NW/4

county: San Juan

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: S€ /i 18] 4 SEC 3 T3LD RULZE STATE:
UTAH
M. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[ acioize (] opeePen [] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
[Vl NoTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ] Aurercasme [] FrAcTURE TREAT [] siDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [] casin RePar [] mewconsTrucTiON [[] TmeEmPORARILY ABANDON
2/28/2008 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [] oPERATOR CHANGE ] vusing REPAIR
[[] cHance TuBING [} PLuG AND ABANDON [C] ventorrLARE
[ sussEQUENT REPORT [[] cHANGE WELL NAME [ pesack [T] wareroisPosaL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[[] cHaNGE weLL STATUS [[] PropucTiON (STARTIRESUME) [] waTer sHuT-OFF
Date of work completion:
] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE ] orher:
] convertwew. Type [C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show afl pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Propose to change the BOP configuration from a 10" X 3000 PSI WP stack using an annular preventer as the top component.
Propose to now use a 11' X 3000 PS| WP stack with an RBOP as the upper most component as per contracted rig inventory.

BOP AS APPROVED

10° 3000 PSIWP.

RAM 10" 3000 PSI WP,

oy
Qy ) RAM 10" 3000 PSIW.P.

X

KILLLINE
Valva#1 — Flanged check vaive

KILL LINE "
Valve #1 mwdm (80P Valves 44 &3 = Flanged minkmum 3" bore Full working pressure of BOP
m o
working pressurs of BOP
Ful Valve #2 — Fianged, minimum 2" bore
Vaiva #2 — Fianged, minimum 2° bore (Note: An HCR can be used Full working prassure of BOP
Fus¥ wosking pressure of BOP instand of Valve ¥ 5)

BOP AS REQUESTED

11" 3000 PSI WP,

~ Flanged minimum 3* bore

CHOKE LINE
Vaives #4 4 5

Full working preasure of BOP

(Note: An HCR can be used
instaad of Vaive # 5)

NAME (PLEASE prinT)_D@Vid Friesen TITLE

Manager, Drilling and Completions

2/1/2008

SIGNATURE DATE

/K-:\
AE
G{;@p’&@ﬂ Ly o

/AR Y
¥ .
Q0P Sﬁhﬂﬂ'ﬁéwaﬁ e Division of

Oater 2-19.2008 @73 wd%'“m“g

“eqeral Approval Of This
Action Is Necessary

intiate: V&S

(512000) P

Jee Instructions on Reverse Side)

RECE\VED
MAR 03 2008
AS & MINING




STATE OF UTAH FORM &
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM
Operator: ~ Baytex Energy USA Ltd Operator Account Number: N_S309
Address: 600 17th Street, Suite 1900 South
city Denver
state CO zip 80202 Phone Number: (303) 825-2777
well 4 _ i
APl Number Well Name | ea | sec | Twp Rng County
4303731879 Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 SENW 13 368 23E San Juan
Action Gode Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Enﬁty Asstg ment

Number Number

_ A 999? 9 1850 412912008 4, /é’ /pg
omments: 3)3(‘/@- o

Well 2
[ APIi Number Well Name aa | sec | Twp | Rng County
ActionCode | Current Entity NewEntity |  Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number , Number Effective Date
Comments:
Well 3
API Number Well Name QQ | Sec | Twp | Rng | County
‘Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Eﬂecﬁve Date
Comments:
ACTION CODES: , .
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) Timothy R. Morris
B - Add new well to existing entity (group or unit well) Name (Please 3nt
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity P f’M f T s
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a nR;Er@E ED < Slgnatu?e
E - Other (Explain in ‘comments’ section) lV Vice President
M AY 0 8 2008 Title Date
(S2000)

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



BAYTEX

ENERGY USA LTD

* CONFIDENTIAL

WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT
Well Name: Devil Mesa 1-13 API #: 43-037-318790000 Division: Denver
Field: Wildcat Well Type: Exploration Property #:
County, State: San Juan, UT Spud Date: Water Depth:
KG/GL Elev: 6,133 est /6,118 Last CSG Size: WI %: 88.89
TD TVD/MD 6,365 /6,581 Shoe TVD/MD
Location: Section 13, T36N, R23E, SENW, 1522 FNL & 2419 FWL
AFE #: 07031788 Operator: Baytex Energy USA Description: Drill & Complete
AFE Total: $1,395,620 Rig Name: Patterson #747 Start Date:  4/17/2008
DHC/CWC: $978,191/ $417,429 Rig Contr: Patterson - UTI Release Date:
Report Date: 5/12/2008 Report By: Dave Friesen
Daily Drilling Costs: WO Revised costs Completion: Daily Total: WO Report
Cum Drilling Costs: Completion: Well Total:
Current MD: 2157 Current TVD: 2157 Progress:
Activity Report
Start End Hrs Activity Description:

18:30
18:30

7-May-08 Moving -In
8-May-08 Rigging-Up

9-May-08 Rig up, spud well at 20:30 H, Drill ahead f/ 72 '- 589', no hole problems
10-May-08 Drill ahead 11" surface hole from 589'-1513', no hole problems
11-May-08 Drill ahead f/ 1513' - 2175’ (proposed surface TD)

RECEIVED
MAY 1 2 2008

DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING
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We“Vie“f Daily Drilling Report for: 5/11/2008
Report #: 6.0, DFS: 2.90
Well Name: DEVIL MESA GAS UNIT 1-13 Depth Progress: 0.00
APIUWI Surface Legal Location License No. Field Name State/Province AFE Number Total AFE Amount
44-037-31879-0000 1522 FNL., 2419 FWL SE/4, NE/4|44-037-3187... |WILDCAT UTA.S. 07031788 989,973.00
Spud Date Rig Release Date Ground Elevation (ft) KB-Ground Distance (ft) Daily Cost Total Cum Cost To Date
5/9/2008 8:30:00 PM 6,118.00 15.00 34,159.82 286,472.87
Weather Temperature (°F) |Road Condition Hole Condition Lease Condition Daily Mud Cost Mud Additive Cost To Date
clear 79.0 dry good 641.82 2,532.87
Operations at Report Time Operations Next Report Period Depth Start (ftKB) Depth End (ffKB)
Wiper tripping at 2100 Pressure testing BOP's,preparing for drill out 1,513.0 1,513.0
Remarks Target Formation Target Depth (ftKB)
Hole going good,rop 120-180'hr. Upper Ismay 6,581.0
Blew swivel packing,trip 3 stands off bottom pior to repairs. Daily Contacts
Bos centifudges working good. . Mgbil
Rigged in mud loggers equipment. Terry Blacquier 403 548 5570

Time Log PATTERSON-UTI DRILLING COMP...
- o b Contractor Rig Number
| Start Time| End Time | Dur (heg) | _(hrs) Qos Category Comment PATTERSON-UTI 747
18:00 [18:30 0.50] 050 LUBRICATE RIG DRILLING COMPANY
18:30 [23:00 450 5.00 DRILL ACTUAL FROM 597 TO 883 Rig Supervisor Phone Mobile
23:00 [23:30 | 050 5.50 DEVIATION SURVEY @ 816 1/2 DEG JEFFERY L PETERS 1505 486 6812
2330 [02:00 | 250 8.00 DRILL ACTUAL FROM 883 TO 1153 § 0':'E$A’ ';;5}? —
02:00 [02:30 | 0.50] 850 DEVIATION SURVEY @ 1101 1/2 DEG i od Dia i)
02:30 |05:00 250 11.00 DRILL ACTUAL FROM 1153 TO 1481 Trer Sz ) [Se0a 79 ol OR
05:00 [05:30 0.50] 11.50 DEVIATION SURVEY @ 1414 2 DEG 61/2 8.00 0.076
05:30 [06:00 0.50] 12.00 DRILL ACTUAL FROM 1481 TO 1513 Pres (psi) |SlowSpd  |Strokes (5... |EF (%)
20 MIN POST TOUR MEETING 1,200.0 [ No 85 80
40 DIESEL ANN 1500 PSI Pres (psi) |Slow Spd Strokes (s... |Eff (%)
D.P INHOLE 31 D.P OUT 221 No 85
06:00 [06:30 | 0.50] 12.50 LUBRICATE RIG ; O'X'EgA» ';;5:’ -
06:30 |09:30 | 3.00] 15.50 DRILL ACTUAL F/ 1513-1605 ey e od Dia (in
09:30 [10:00 0.50[ 16.00 TRIP OUT 3 STANDS-DERRICKMAN 100% TIED OFF SY, HB, TY, | [Trersze ) [Stoke ) VolSK ORI
JLP 61/2 8.00 0.076
10:00 [11:30 150 17.50 O/X SWIVEL PACKING-CIRC WELL 15 MIN-TIH DM 100% SY, HB, | [Fres (psh [SiowSpd _[Strokes (.. [EF (%)
TY, JLP 1,200.0 [ No 85 a0
11:30 [13:00 150 19.00 DRILL ACTUAL F/ 1605-1639 Pres (psi) |SiowSpd  |Strokes (s... [Eff (%)
13:00 |13:30 | 0.50] 19.50 DEVIATION SURVEY @1571 MISS FIRE No 85
13:30 [15:00 1.50] 21.00 DRILL ACTUALF/1639-1670 Mud Additive Amounts
15:00 [15:30 0.50] 21.50 DEVIATION SURVEY @1603 ___ Description CosfGuriii [Consumed|
15:30 [16:00 0.50] 22.00 FIX FLOWLINE-CAME OUT OF BOOT Lime 6.40 1.0
16:00 [18:00 2.00] 24.00 DRILL ACTUAL F/1670-1733 EZ-Mud 67.22) 10
10MINS POSTTOUR Baracarb 50 16.25 6.0
1,592.0tKB, 5/11/2008 18:00 Baracarb 150 16.25| 6.0
Type Time Depth (fKB) Density (Ib/gal) Vis (s/qt) PV Override (cp) YP OR (Ibff100f®%) Gel 6.10 12.0
Gel-Chem 18:00 1,592.0 8.90 32 mudcheck 300.00 1.0
Gel 10 sec (Ibf/100ft2) | Gel 10 min ((bff100ft) | Filtrate (mi/30min) Filter Cake {/32") pH Sand (%) Solids (%)
4,000 7.000 19.0 2 9.0 2.7 Safety Checks o
MBT (b/bbl) Alkalinity (mLUmL) Chiorides (mg/L) Caicium (mglL) Pf (mimL) Pm {mbmL) Gel 30 min (Ibf100f%) | |—Time. Type | Description
15.0 100.000 40.000
Whiole Mud Added (bbl Mud Lost to Hole (bbl) Mud Lost to Surface (bbl) Reserve Mud Volume (bbl) Active Mud Volume (bbl)
5.0 446.0 Wellbores
<Depth7>tKB, 511212008 09:00 TS
Type Time Depth (ffKB) Density (Ib/gal) Vis (s/qt) PV Override (cp) YP OR (Ibf/100ft%)
09:00 9.20 46 Most Recent Casing String
Gel 10 sec (Ib100f%) | Gel 10 min (Ibf/100f#) | Filtrate (mL/30min) [ Filter Cake (/32") pH Sand (%) Solids (%) Set Depth
9.5 Casing Descrigtion | (%KB) Run Date
MBT (Io/bbl) Alkalinity (nLmL)  |Chlorides (mg/L) | Calcium (mg/L) Pf (mLimL) Pm (mmL) Gel 30 min (b7100%%) | |Surface 2,178.015/12/2008
Whole Mud Added (bbl Mud Lost to Hole (bbl) Mud Lost to Surface (bbl) Reserve Mud Volume (bbl) Active Mud Volume (bbl)
RECEIVED
Bit Run [Drill Bit Length (ft) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (in®) BHA ROP...
Nozzles (/32") String Length (ft) lOD (in) MAY ] 3 2008
String Components
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING
Comment
Cum
Drill
Cum Depth Time |IntROP | Q(flow) | WOB | RPM Rot HL PUHL
Wellbore Start (fKB) | End (fKB) (it) {hrs) (fhry | (gom) (10000} (rpm) | SPP (psiy | (1000ibf {100016f) . | Drill T
www.peloton.com Page 1/1 Report Printed: 5/13/2008




WeIIViev\f Daily Drilling Report for: 5/10/2008
Report #: 5.0, DFS: 1.90
Well Name: DEVIL MESA GAS UNIT 1-13 Depth Progress: 916.00
APIUWI Surface Legal Location License No. Field Name State/Province AFE Number Total AFE Amount
44-037-31879-0000 1522 FNL, 2419 FWL SE/4, NE/4]44-037-3187... |WILDCAT UTIUS. 07031788 989,973.00
Spud Date Rig Release Date Ground Elevation (ft) KB-Ground Distance (ft) Daily Cost Total Cum Cost To Date
5/9/2008 8:30:00 PM 6,118.00 15.00 30,201.10 252,313.05
Weather Temperature (°F} |Road Condition Hole Condition Lease Condition Daily Mud Cost Mud Additive Cost To Date
clear 64.0 d 636.10 1,891.
Operations at Report Time ~ Operations I\Sx? gedport Period Depth Start (ftkKB) Depth Ends(gKB)05
Driliing ahead at 1481' Running 8 5/8 casing 597.0 1,613.0
Remarks Target Formation Target Depth (ftKB)
Hole drilling good,and cleaning well. Upper Ismay 6,581.0
A few minor rig repairs, rotary chain,releveled sub Daily Contacts
Time Log Tory Blaoquior 703 548 5570
Cum Dur
Time| End Time | Dur (hes) | (hrs) Ops Category Comment PATTERSON-UTI DRILLING COMP...
18:00 |[18:30 0.50 0.50 LUBRICATE RIG Contractor Rig Number
18:30 [19:00 0.50 1.00 MU BIT & RUN IN HOLE-TAG @ 72 PATTERSON-UTI 747
19:00 [20:30 1.50 2.50 DRILLING CEMENT DRILLING COMPANY
20:30 {23:30 3.00 5.50 DRILL ACTUAL FROM 72 TO 247 Rig Supervisor Phone Mobile
23:30 |00:00 | 0.50] 6.00 DEVIATION SURVEY @ 247 1 DEG JEFFERYL PETERS 505 486 6812
00:00 |01:00 | 1.00] 7.00 DRILL ACTUAL FROM 247 TO 301 E o'x'EgA' L-750 —
01:00 |01:30 | 050] 7.50 LUBRICATE RIG R I RodDia (n)
01:30 |03:30 2.00] 9.50 DRILL ACTUAL FROM 301 TO 370 T See 7 [SvoRe 7 VTS OR B
03:30 _|04:00 0.50] 10.00 REPAIR RIG FIX ROTERY CHAIN 6 1/2 8.00 0.076
04:00 |04:30 0.50] 10.50 DRILL ACTUAL FROM 370 TO 392 Pres (psi) |SlowSpd  |Strokes (... |Eff (%)
04:30 |05:00 0.50] 11.00 DEVIATION SURVEY @ 352 1/2 DEG 500.0 No 75
05:.00 |06:00 1.00| 12.00 DRILL ACTUAL FROM 392 TO 450 Pres (psi)  [Slow Spd | Strokes (s... |Eff (%)
10 MIN POST TOUR MEETING No 85
DIESEL 50 INC 1, OMEGA, L-750
06:00 |06:30 | 0.50] 12.50 LUBRICATE RIG i i Rod Dia ()
06:30 {07:00 0.50] 13.00 DRILL ACTUAL F/450 T/480 Liner Size (in) | Stroke (in) Vol/Stk OR (bbl...
07:00 {07:30 0.50] 13.50 CIRCULATE 61/2 8.00 0.076
07:30 |09:30 2.00f 15.50 LD 1 DC & TOOH FIMUD MOTOR & PDC BIT Pres (psi) |SlowSpd  |Strokes (s... |Eff (%)
09:30 |11:00 1.50] 17.00 MU 8 MUD MOTOR ,BIT SUB &TIH 100% TIED OFF 500.0 No 75
11:00 [11:30 0.50] 17.50 REAMING F/335-T/352 Pres (psi)  [SlowSpd  |Strokes (s... |Eff (%)
11:30_[12:00 | 0.50] 18.00 TIH TAG @375 No 8
12:00 [13:00 1.00f 19.00 P/U KELLY REAMING F/375 -T/407 Mud Additive Amounts
13:00 [13:30 0.50] 19.50 LEVEL DERRICK Description Cost (funit) | Consumed
13:30 [15:00 150[_21.00 REAMING F/407 -T/480 Gel 6.10[ 41.0
15:00 [16:30 1.50| 22.50 DRILL ACTUAL F/480- 597 mudcheck 300.00 1.0
16:30 |17:00 0.50] 23.00 DEVIATION SURVEY @527 | Cedar Fiber 10.75] 8.0
17:00 [18:00 | 1.00] 24.00 INSTALL DRLG RUBBER Safety Checks
DIESEL:47 e Tus Desaition
ACC:1900 PSI
10 POSTTOUR
407.07tKB, 5/10/2008 12:00 , , Wellbores ,
Type Time Depth (fKB) Density (b/gal) Vis (s/qt) PV Overde () VP OR (671007 | j—WelboreName = | - KO WD (RKE)
Gel-Chem 12:00 407.0 8.50 32 | Original Hole |
Gel 10 sec (Ibf/100ft?) [ Gel 10 min (Ibf/100ft) | Filtrate (mL/30min, Filter Cake (/32" Sand (% Solids (% . .
3000 L 5000 | a0 o " 100 " "7 Most Recent Casing tring
MBT (Ib/;b.lg Alkalinity {mL/mL} Chlon:(e)so (%%'3 Calcuuz o(mdgloL()) Pf (ml/mL) Pm (mL/mL) Gel 30 min (Ibf/100ft%) Casing Descrintion (AKB) RunDate |
Whole Mud Added (bbl Mud Lost to Hole (bbl) Mud Lost to Surface (bbl) Reserve Mud Volume (bbl) Active Mud Volume (bbl)
4.0 260.0 313.0
<Depth?>ftKB, 5/11/2008 13:30
Type Time Depth (fKKB) Density (Ib/gal) Vis (s/qt) PV Override (cp) YP OR (Ibf/100ft*)
13:30 8.70 33
Gel 10 sec (Ibf/100ft?) | Gel 10 min (Ibf/100f?) | Filtrate (mL/30min) Filter Cake (/32") pH Sand (%) Solids (%)
10.5
MBT (Ib/bbl) Alkalinity (mb/mL) Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) Pf (mb/mL) Pm (mL/mL) Gel 30 min (Ibf/100ft%)

Whole Mud Added (bbl)

Mud Lost to Hole (bbl)

Mud Lost to Surface (bbl)

Reserve Mud Volume (bbl}

Active Mud Volume (bbl)

BHA #2, Drilling Assembly

Bit Run | Drill Bit

2

11in, <Model?>, <SN?>

Length (ft)

IADC Bit Dull

TFA (incl Noz) (in)
1.35

BHAROP...
91.6

Nozzles (/32") String Length (ft) OD (in)
14/14/14/14/14/14/14/14/14 1,472.56 I
String Components
TRENDON, MOTOR, X.0., D.C., Drill pipe - Stands, Drill pipe - Singles
Comment

www.peloton.com
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WellView

Well Name: DEVIL MESA GAS UNIT 1-13

Daily Drilling

Report for: 5/10/2008
Report #: 5.0, DFS: 1.90
Depth Progress: 916.00

Wellbore Start (fIKB)

Q (flow)
(gpm}

Rot HL
(1000Ibf)

PUHL
{1000ibf)

Qriginal Hole 597.0

www.peloton.com

Report Printed: 5/13/2008




WelView Daily Drilling Report for: 5/9/2008
Well N DEVIL ME Report #: 4.0, DFS: 0.90
ell Name: SA GAS UNIT 1-13 Depth Progress: 557.00
APIUWI Surface Legal Location License No. Field Name State/Province AFE Number Total AFE Amount
44-037-31879-0000 1522 FNL, 2419 FWL SE/4, NE/4{44-037-3187... |WILDCAT UTM.S. 07031788 989,973.00
Spud Date Rig Release Date Ground Elevation (ft) KB-Ground Distance (ft) Daily Cost Total Cum Cost To Date
5/9/2008 8:30:00 PM 6,118.00 15.00 26,246.45 222,111.95
Weather Temperature (°F) |Road Condition Hole Condition Lease Condition Daily Mud Cost Mud Additive Cost To Datel
clear 72.0 dry good 866.45 1,254.95
Operations at Report Time Operations Next Report Period Depth Start (ftKB) Depth End (ftKB)
Drilling ahead at 430' Drilling 11" hole ahead 72.0 589.0
Remarks Target Formation Target Depth (ftiKB)
Note :Notifications sent to Jeff Brown / BLM & Carol Daniels / UOGC via voice mail of spud times Upper Ismay 6,581.0
: Changed out rig pump,looks like mainshaft was broken on rig move. Daily Contacts
: 8 5/8 " J55 casing delivered today Job Contact Mobile
: Spudded in 05/09/08@ 20:30hrs Terry Blacquier 403 548 5570
Time Log PATTERSON-UTI DRILLING COMP...
Cum Dur Contractor Rig Number
me | Durihrsy ] (ors) | Qps Category Cormment PATTERSON-UTI 747
18:00 |20:30 250 2.50 RIG UP-MOVE TRAILERS ON LOCATION DRILLING COMPANY
20:30 100:00 3.50] 6.00 NIPPLE UP B.O.P. ON 85 CONDUCTOR PIPE Rig Supervisor Phone Mobile
00:00 [03:00 | 3.00] 9.00 NIPPLE UP B.O.P. ON 85 CONDUCTOR PIPE JEFFERY L PETERS _ [505 486 6812
03:00 [04:30 | 1.50] 10.50 P/U MUD MOTOR & BIT & PRE SPUD INSPECTION g OMEgAs ';15:’ —
04:30 |06:00 | 1.50| 12.00 DRILL RATHOLE R i od Dia (i)
56 DIESEL Liner Size (in) _|Stroke (n) VoliStk OR (bbl...
10 MIN POST TOUR MEETING 8.00
06:00 |06:30 0.50] 12.50 LUBRICATE RIG Pres (psi) [SlowSpd  |Strokes (s... Eff (%)
06:30 |08:30 2.00f 14.50 DRILL RATHOLE &MOUSE HOLE v No 75
08:30 |16:00 7.50] 22.00 RU #1 PUMP-DROP GUY LINE TO RU BOSS-X/O CHARGE 1, OMEGA, L-750
PUMP-UNLOAD 8 5/8 CASING Pump Number | Pwr (hp) Rod Dia (in)
16:00 |18:00 2.00| 24.00 /D MUD MOTOR-RIG UP BALES & EL EVATORS-P/U BHA — Si:e TS VoIS OR G
10 MIN POST TOUR SM 6 1/2 8.00 0.076
S YELLOWMAN 100 MILES Pres (psi} |Slow Spd Strokes (s... |Eff (%)
<Depth?>ftKB, 5/10/2008 05:00 . 800.0 No 75
Type Time Depth (ftKB) Density (Ib/gal) Vis {s/qt) PV Override (cp) YP OR (Ibf/100ft%) Pres (psi) | Siow Spd Strokes (s... |Eff (%)
05:00 8.50 32 No 75
Gel 10 sec (Ib7100ft%) | Gel 10 min (IbT100fE) | Fitrate (mL/30miny | Filter Cake (/32") | pH Sand (%) Solids (%)
9.5 Mud Additive Amounts
MET (lb/bbl) ‘Akalinity (mUmL) Chiorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) Pf (mLmL) Pm (mLjmL) Gel 30 min (Ibi/100fE) Description Cost (funit)_1Consumed
mudcheck 300.00 1.0
Whole Mud Added (bbi Mud Lost to Hole (bbl) Mud Lost to Surface (bbl) Reserve Mud Volume (bbl)  JActive Mud Volume (bbi) Gel 6.10f 40.0
Caustic 2245 1.0
BHA #1, Drilling Assembly mudcheck 300.00 1.0
Bit Run | Drill Bit Tength () [IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (in?) | BHA ROP...
1 |1Min,FDS,LT875%0 | | e 446 ||Safety Checks
Nozzies (/327) String Length (f)) OD (in) i Type. | Description
588.36 |
String Components
FDS, BIT SUB, D.C., Drill pipe - Stands, Drill pipe - Singles Wewjf"es
Comment - -
Original Hole
Sum Most Recent Casing String
CumDepth | Time |intROP|Q (flow) | WoB | RPM RotHL | PUHL ) o Se:‘E;P‘h
Welbore | Start(KB) | End (k@) I (hrs) | @) | (gom) (100006 (om) | SPP (osiy | (10000 | (100080 |pril Tg | |-Sesina Description 1 (WKE) RunDate |
Original Hole 72.0 450.0{ 378.00| 7.50| 50.4 20 99| 400.0
| Original Hole 410.0 589.0| 557.00| 12.50] 35.8 201 99} 400.0
www.peloton.com Page 1/1 Report Printed: 5/13/2008




W&INIQV\; Daily Drilling Report for: 5/8/2008

Report #: 3.0, DFS: -0.10
Well Name: DEVIL MESA GAS UNIT 1-13 Depth Progress:

APIUWI Surface Legal Location License No. Field Name State/Province AFE Number Total AFE Amount
44-037-31879-0000 1522 FNL, 2419 FWL SE/4, NE/4}44-037-3187... |WILDCAT UTU.S. 07031788 989,973.00
Spud Date Rig Release Date Ground Elevation (ft) KB-Ground Distance (ft) Daily Cost Total Cum Cost To Date
5/9/2008 8:30:00 PM 6,118.00 15.00 195,865.50 195,865.50
Weather Temperature (°F) [Road Condition Hole Condition Lease Condition Daily Mud Cost Mud Additive Cost To Date|
showers 63.0 muddy 388.50 388.50
Operations at Report Time Operations Next Report Period Depth Start (ftKB) Depth End (ftKB)
Drilling rathole Drilling 11" surface hole
Remarks Target Formation Target Depth (ftKB)
Held tailgate safety meeting with crews & trucking personal. Upper Ismay 6,581.0
Move went fairly good,no nproblems, a little slow due to smalll location Daily Contacts )
Derrick in the @ 08/05/08 -09:30hrs Job Contact Mokile
Time Log Terry Blacquier 403 548 5570
Cum Dur PATTERSON-UTI DRILLING COMP...
ime | Dur (hrs) | (hrs) Qps Category Comment Contractor Rig Number
18:00 |06:00 | 12.00| 12.00 MOVE EQUIPMENT TO NEW LOCATION PATTERSON-UTI 747
10 MIN POST TOUR SM DRILLING COMPANY A
06:00 [08:00 2.00] 14.00 RIG UP &GROUND WORK Rig Supervisor Phone Mabile
08:00 [09:30 | 1.50] 15.50 DERRICK RAISING &LOCK DOG IN @930 S.Y. D.B.B. JLP JEFFERYL PETERS  |505 486 6812
09:30 |16:00 | 6.50] 22.00 RIG UP 8GROUND WORK 2, OMEGA, l;zrf,?) BT
16:00 {18:00 2.00| 24.00 M/U O/X SUB &KELLY VAVLE &KELLY P 2 i
10MINS POSTTOUR Tiner Size (n) | Stroke (i) Vol/Stk OR (Gbl...
STEVEN YELLOWMAN DROVE 310 8.00
DAVID BEGAY DROVE 310 Pres (psi) [SlowSpd  [Strokes (s... |Eff (%)
No
Type Time Depth (KB) Density (Ib/gal) Vis (siqt) PV Override (cp) YP OR (1bf/100fE) 1, OMEGA, L-750
Pump Number | Pwr (hp) Rod Dia (in)
Gel 10 sec (Ibf1001t%) | Gel 10 rmin (Ibf/1001) |Filtrate (mL/30min) | Filter Cake (/32°)  |pH Sand (%) Solids (%) 1
Liner Size (in} | Stroke (in) Vol/Stk OR (bbl...
MBT (Ib/bbl) Alkalinity (mU/mL) __[Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) Pf (miJmL) Pm (mLimL) Gel 30 min (Ibf/1007) 8.00
Pres (psi) |SlowSpd  |Strokes (s... |Eff (%)
Whole Mud Added (bbl Mud Lost to Hole (bbl) Mud Lost to Surface (bbl) Reserve Mud Volume (bbl) Active Mud Volume (bbl) No
Mud Additive Amounts
Bit Run [Drill Bit Tength () [IADC Bit Dull TFA (inci Noz) (in?) | BHA ROP... _Mm_Walnut %mﬁ
Nozzies (32 String Length () |oo I mudcheck 300.00 1.0
i Safety Checks )
String Components T Toe D o
Comment
Wellbores
S”-T? Wellbore Name KO MD (fKB)
ri i
CumDepth | Time |[intROP }Q(flow) | WOB | RPM Rot HL PU HL Original Flole
Wellore | Stert (W) | End(®@) L (0 1 (ve) L (Who) | (pm) |(1000001 (pm) | SPP (osi) 1 (1000BD L (100060 1DrilTa] |Most Recent Casing String
Set Depth
- Casing Description (fKB) RunDate |
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WeINiew Da"y DriIIing Report for: 5/7/2008

Report #: 2.0, DFS: -1.10
Well Name: DEVIL MESA GAS UNIT 1-13 Depth Progress:

APIUWI Surface Legal Location License No. Field Name State/Pravince AFE Number Total AFE Amount
44-037-31879-0000 1522 FNL, 2419 FWL SE/4, NE/4{44-037-3187... |WILDCAT UTAU.S. 07031788 989,973.00
Spud Date Rig Release Date Ground Elevation (ft) KB-Ground Distance (ft) Daily Cost Total Cum Cost To Date
5/9/2008 8:30:00 PM 6,118.00 15.00
Weather Temperature (°F) |Road Condition Hole Condition Lease Condition Daily Mud Cost Mud Additive Cost To Date|
clear 72.0 dry
Operations at Report Time Operations Next Report Period Depth Start (ftKB) Depth End (ftKB)
Spotting rig and equipment Preparing to spud
Remarks Target Formation Target Depth (ftkB)
Vey tight comers on lease road coming into location,larger loads having troubles ; ie rig,mud tanks,shacks.. Upper Ismay 6,581.0
Watering road as per BLM request. Daily Contacts ’
Time Log ‘ Joo Contact Mobile
Cum Dur Terry Blacquier 403 548 5570
i Time | Dur hrs) | (hrs) Ops Catedory Comment PATTERSON-UTI DRILLING COMP...
18:00 |06:00 12.00] 12.00 RIGGING DN & W/O TRUCKS Contractor Rig Number
HOPPER DROVE 150MI PATTERSON-UTI 747
06:00 [18:00 12.00{ 24.00 MOVE RIG TO NEW LOCATION DRILLING COMPANY
10 MIN POST TOUR SM Rig Supervisor Phone Mobile
STEVEN YELLOWMAN DROVE 310 MILES ;E';FME’;& PLE‘;';S 505 486 6812
DAVID BEGAY DROVE 310 MILES P:xmp Nt oo = *od DAt
Type Time Depth (ftKB) Density (Ib/gal} Vis (s/qt) PV Override (cp) YP OR (Ibf/1001t?) Tner Sizze ™ |Sroke @) VolStk OR (b
Gel 10 sec (Ib7100f¢) | Gel 10 min (b7 100fE) | Filtrate (mL/30min) | Filter Cake (/32") oH Sand (%) Solids (%) Fres (pe) Sow Spad S'OSmkes o )
MBT (Ib/bbi) Alkalinity (mL/mL) Chlorides (mg/L) Caicium (mg/L) P (mL/mL) Prm (mmL) Gel 30 min (Ibf100fF) T OMEGA. If\-k;50
Whole Mud Added (bb Wud Lost 1o Hole (567} Wud Lost to Surface (bbi) Reserve Mud Voluma (ob)  JActive Mud Volume (ool Pump N‘;mbe’ P (hp) Rod Dia (in)
Liner Size (in) | Stroke (in) VoliStk OR (ob...
- —— - - — 8.00
Bit Run [Drill Bit Length ()  |IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (i)~ [BRAROP...| [=— TR S S o B
Nozzles (/32"} String Length (ft) 0D (in) No
Mud Additive Amounts
String Components Description Cost (unit) |Consumed|
Comment
Safety Checks
Cum | Time Tvpe Description
Drill
CumDepth | Time |IntROP |Q(flow) | woB | RPM Rot HL PUHL
Wellbore Start(@KkB) | End (RKB) (ft) thrs). |- (fhr) | (gpm) |(1000IbR] (pm) | SPP (psi) | (1000bA | (10006 |Drill Tg| iWelibores
Wellbore Name KQ MD (fKB)
Original Hole

Most Recent Casing String
Set Depth
|..Casing Description | (KB) RunDate |
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WeIMew Daily Drilling Report for: 5/6/2008
Report #: 1.0, DFS: -2.10
Well Name: DEVIL MESA GAS UNIT 1-13 Depth Progress:
APHUWI Surface Legal Location License No. Field Name State/Province AFE Number Total AFE Amount
44-037-31879-0000 1522 FNL, 2419 FWL SE/4, NE/4]44-037-3187... [WILDCAT UTMU.S. 07031788 989,973.00
Spud Date Rig Release Date Ground Elevation (ft) KB-Ground Distance (it} Daily Cost Total Cum Cost To Date
5/9/2008 8:30:00 PM 6,118.00 15.00
Weather Temperature (°F) [Road Condition Hole Condition Lease Condition Daily Mud Cost Mud Additive Cost To Date
Operations at Report Time Operations Next Report Period Depth Start (f(KB) Depth End (RKB)
Remarks Target Formation Target Depth (ftiKB)
Upper Ismay 6,581.0
Time Log Daily Contacts
Cum Dur Job Contact | Mobileg |
Start Time| End Time | Dur (hrs) {__(hrs) Ops Category Comment
18:00 |06:00 12.00] 12.00 RIG DOWN PATTERSON-UTI DRILLING COMP...
JEREMY HORTON DROVE 150 MILES™ Contractor Rig Number
SM JEREMY FWLEON FORKLIFT OP HARVEY PATTERSON-UTI 747
DIESEL= 26 DRILLING COMPANY
H20 IN RIG TANK=1/2 Rig Supervisor Phone Mabile
06:00 11800 12,00 24.00 JEFFERY L PETERS |505 486 6812
2, OMEGA, L-750
Type Time Depth (RKB) Density (b/gal) Vis (s/ft) PV Override (cp) _ |YP OR (710079 Pump N;mbe' Par (hp) Rod Dia (in)
Gel 10 sec (Ib7100f%) | Gel 10 min (7100 |Filtrate (mL/30min) | Filter Gake (327 |pHi Sand (%) Solids (%) Liner Size () Smkes(ig)o VoliStk OR (obt...
MBT (1b/bbl) Alkalnity (mLjmL) __|Chlorides (mglt) | Calcium (mgiL) Pf (mimL) Brn (mmL) ol 50 roim (om0 | | res (si) S"”"'jgd Strokes (s... [Ef (%)
Whole Mud Added (0ol Mud Lost to Hole (bbi) Mud Lost to Surface (bbl) Reserve Mud Volume (bb) |Active MUd Volume (bbi) 1, OMEGA, L-750
Pump Number | Pwr (hp) Rod Dia (in)
1
Bit Run [Orill Bt Tongh () TTADC B Dl TEA (ol Noz) (m) JBRAROP_.] |-"er Size (n) smk‘é(i(”))o Vol/Stk OR (obl...
Nozzles (32%) String Length (7) |oo ] Pres (psi) Sb‘”rigd Strokes (s... | EFF (%)
String Components Mud Additive Amounts
Description 1 Cast (unity Consumed|
Comment |
Cum Safety Checks
prill [Time Twe Descrintion
CumDepth | Time [IntROP |Q(flow) | WOB | RPM Rot HL PUHL
Wellbore Start (fKB). | _End (KB) ) (hrs) 1 (fhr) | (gpm) |(1000If)} (rpm) | SPP (psiy | (1000bf | (10001f) | Drill Tg
Wellbores
Wellbore Name KO MD (fKEY
Original Hole
Most Recent Casing String
Set Depth
|_Casing Degcription, fB) . 1. RunDate |

www.peloton.com
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\ AT
STATE OF UTAH C H F ﬁ EE\D&, FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER
JTUO76834

B IF INDIAN, ALLDTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

; s form 1 s to dst e sianficant d s bel | N ‘ _— ) JNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME.
T30 not use (his form for proposals o dril new weils, significantly deepen existing wells befow current boficm-hole depth, reerter plugged vialis, or 1o y 2
drill horizontal iatarals, Lse APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals ev 1 1 M esa. Uni t U T U 08 5 B4 9 X

4. TYPE OF WELL B, WELL NAME and NUMBER

oL weLL [ GAS WELL OTHER . i
B De.vi“l. Mega Unitp 1-13

3 NAME OF OPERATOR 9, AP NUMBER
Bavtex Epnereyv UTUSA Ltd 4303731879
3 ADDRESS OF DPERATOR, PHONE N 5 NUMBER- 76 FIELD AND POOL, OR VALDCAT
600 17th Street, Suite 19008, Denwver CO SOZaQ gog 9229 undesjgnated
4 LOCATION OF WELL e e
FGCOTAGES AT SURFACE, p . . COUNTY,
1522" FNL, 2419' FWL San Juan
QTRIITR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE. MERIDIAN: ‘ STATE:
SE/4NW/4 Sec 13 - T36S-R23E UTAH
. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(] NOTICE OF INTENT
{Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: CASING REPAIR HEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON
CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

[} sUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit Originat Form Cnly)

CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOBAL

; CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME} WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE

ooooooog

OTHER:

SONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

ORI ooo0o0
ooooooooo

12, DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent detalls including dates, depths, volurmas, etc

Request change to "Confidential"™ Status

RECEIVED
MAY 15 2008

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

we Senior Land Administrator
5/15/08

MAKIE (PLEASE PRINEITL ., Eobin. D, .C1l }afﬁ,

siGMATURE __ {7

). L e o

s
a——

{This space for State use only)

1BI2000) {3=e Insiructions on Reverse Side)



BAY TEX Daily Drilling o w1 g Report for: 5/14/2008
Well Name: DEVIL MESA UNIT 1-13 C‘j? ““: ! ﬂ Eg‘ﬂ i %ESP ort #: 9.0, DFS: 5.90
. epth Progress: 76.00

API/UWI Surface Legal Location License No. State/Province AFE Number Total AFE Amount
44-037-31879-0000 1522 FNL, 2419 FWL SE/4, |44-037-31879-0000 UT/U.S. 07031788 989,973.00
NE/4 Daily Cost Total Cum Cost ToDate

Spud Date Rig Release Date Ground Elevation (ft} KB-Ground Distance (ft) 43,034.20 505,150.07

5/9/2008 8:30:00 PM 6,118.00 15.00 Daily Mud Cost Mud Cum To Date
Weather Temperature (°F) Road Conditon Hole Condition” 319.20 2,940.57
cloudy 62.0 drying good Depth Start (ftKB} Depth End (fiKB)
Operations at Report Time Operations Next Report Pericd 2,178.0 2,254.0
Drilling ahead at 2722' Drilling ahead Target Formation Target Depth (ftkB)
Operations Summary Upper Ismay ‘ 6,581.0
Reporty for May 14/05 - 00:00 to 24:00hrs Last Casing String

Surface, 2,178.0ftkB

Ranin 6 1/4 DC's & 12 DP,laid down.Moved DC's,HWDP strap pipe.Made up directional tools and MWD.Picked Daily Contacts
up HWDP and ran in with bit #1{UD513}.Rigged in bleed off and flare lines.Picked up HWDP,ran in with bit{tag cmt Yy Tob Contact Y

2125} Drilled out float and shoe.Directionaly drill 7 7/8" hole{2178 to 2510'},surveying as required. Terry Blacquier 403548 5570

PATTERSON-UTI DRILLING COM...

Contractor Rig Number
PATTERSON-UTI 747
DRILLING COMPANY

Rig Supervisor

Operations - May 15/05 - 00:00 to 06:00

Directional drilled 7 7/8" hole {2510 to 2645'}.Repair rig{drive chain}.Directioally drilled 7 7/8" hole{2645 to 2728'}.

Phone Mobile

Time Log JEFFERY L PETERS |505 486 6812
Start End Cum Dur | Code e "
Time | Time |Dur(hrs)| (hrs) | 1 Code 2 Comment ,?u’m‘g",j'ife‘,‘ * L;,er(gp) Rod Dia ()
18:00 |23:30 5.50| 5.50{15 |TEST B.O.P. |TIGHT FLANGES ON B.O.P** TEST BLIND RAMS 250 PSi 2
LOW 5 MINS **2000 HIGH 10 MINS liner Size (in) | Siroke (n) ~ [Vol/STk O (b
23:30 103:30 4.00f 9.50(15 |TEST B.O.P. |BLINDS RAMS/QUTSIDE MANFOLD VALUES/BLIND 61/2 8.00 0.076
RAMS/STINGER VALUE/KILL VALUE Liner Size (in) | Stroke (in) Vol/Stk OR (b...
TEST B.O.P. 6 8.00
03:30 |04:30 | 1.00| 10.50(6 |TRIPS ~  [T.LH8STDS D/C 10 STDS D/P D/H 100% TIE OFF DB DB | [ree(pe) Sioned [Stwates (5. ER (0
SC
04:30 [06:00 | 1.50] 12.00/21 |MOVE D.Cs &|MOVE D.Cs& MOVE F/W D.P & STRAP SAME 1, OMEGA, ';,;5(3) D
W/P FUEL:53 RIG H20: FULL " P
N o DAVE DROVE 310 MI!’I?S e Liner Size (in) |Stroke (in) Vol/Stk OR (b...
06:00 |07:00 1.00| 13.00/20 |DIR. WORK |MAKE UP MOTOR & SCRIBE, TEST MOTOR 61/2 8.00 0.076
07:00 |10:00 3.00| 16.00{6 |TRIPS MAKE UP P.D.CBIT& TILHW/BHA Pres (psi) [SlowSpd  |Strokes (s... |Eff (%)
10:00 |10:30 0.50{ 16.50|7 |LUBRICATE |LUBRICATE RIG (CHECK ALL EQUIP.) No
RIG Mud Additive Amounts
10:30 |12:00 1.50| 18.00|(1 RIGUP & FINISH RIGGING UP BLEED-OFF LINES Description Cost (unit) |Consum...
TEARDOWN mudcheck 300.00 1.0
12:00 |13:30 | 150| 19.50(6 [TRIPS T..H (DERRICK MAN 100% TIED-OFF,LMHBMKP Soda Ash 9.60 2.0
13:30 [14:30 1.00] 20.50(21 {\/AV/OPVE D.Cs & |PICK UP PIPE & TAG CMT. @ 2125 & DRILL CMT TO/2178 Safety Checks
Time Type | Description
14:30 (18:00 3.50| 24.00/2 |DRILL DRILL. ACTUAL F/ 2178 T/ 2254
ACTUAL LUIS MARIN DROVE 310 MILES***
SM JEREMY F/W MITCHELL FORKLIFT OP. HARVEY Wellbores
Wellbore Name KO MD (fikB)
2,178.0ﬂKB, 5/14/2008 18:00 Original Hole
Type Time Depth (ftKB) Density (Ib/gal) Vis (s/qt) PV Override (cp) YP OR (Ibf/100ft2}
Floc Water 18:00 2,178.0 8.40 27 1.0 1.000
Gel (10s) (Ibf/100f2) |Gel (1om) (ibf/100f?) [Filtrate (ml/30min) |Filter Cake (/32")  [pH T Sand (%) Solids (%)
1.000 1.000 50.0 10.0 0.2
MBT {Ib/bbl) Alkalinity (mL/mL) _ |Chlorides (mg/L} __|Calcium (mg/L} Pf (mL/mL) Pm (mL/mL) Gel (30m) (Ib7100E)
200.000 200.000 HEC
[Whole Mud Added (bbl)  |Mud Lost to Hole (bbl) Mud Lost to Surface (bbl) Reserve Mud Volume (bbl)  [Active Mud Volume (bbl}
621.0 E' VE D
«<Depth?>ftKB, 5/15/2008 05:30
Type Time Depth (ftkKB) Density {Ib/gal) Vis (s/qt) PV Override (cp}) YP OR (Ibf/100ft?) MAY 1 5 2008
05:30 8.40 28
Gel (10s) (Ibf/100ft2) |Gel (10m) (Ibf/100ft2) |Filtrate (mL/30min) |Filter Cake (/32" pH Sand (%) Solids (%)
14.0 9.5 B DIV OF OIL, GAS & MINING
'MBT (ib/bbi) | Alkalinity (mL/mL)  |Chlorides (mg/L)  [Calcium (mg/L) P (mL/mL) Pm (mlimby  [Gel (30m) (Ibf/100ft8)
Whole Mud Added (bbl} Mud Lost to Hole (bbl) Mud Lost to Surface (bbl) Reserve Mud Volume (bbl)  |Active Mud Volume (bbl)

BHA #3, Drilling Assembly
Bit Run | Drill Bit

1 |7 7/8in, UD513, 4332
'Nozzles (/32"

Length (ft) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (in3)  |[BHARO...

String Length (/) ’on (in)

1,012.87

7.875

String Components

United UD513, PDC Bit, Mud Motor - Bent Housing, UBHO, NMDC, HWDP

[Comment

www.peloton.com Page 1/2 Report Printed: 5/15/2008




BAYTEX Daily Drilling | | MEITEMTIA
eport #: 9.0, : 5.

Well Name: DEVIL MESA UNIT 1-13 Depth Progress: 76.00

Cum
Drill
Cum Depth| TIMe Hint ROP | Q (flow) | WOB | RPM Rot HL PU HL
Wellbore | Start (ftkB) | End (ftkB) (ft) (hrs) | (swnr) | (gpm) |(1000L..| (rpm) | SPP (psi) | (1000Ibf) | (1000Ibf) | Drill Tq
Original Hole |  2,178.0] 2,254.0/ 76.00

www.peloton.com Page 2/2 Report Printed: 5/15/2008
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May 27, 2008

BAYTEX

ENERGY USA LTD

Divisior f 011 G and Mlmng
1594 Wkt'Ndith empl'e Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Attn: Carol Daniels

RE: Baytex Energy USA Ltd
May 2008 — Weeks 2 to 4 Drilling Reports
Devil Mesa Unit #1-13 Well
API Well No. 43-037-31879
Section 13, T36S — R23E, SENW
San Juan County, Utah

Dear Ms. Daniels,

CONFIDENTIAL

Please find copies of the Baytex Energy USA Ltd Drilling Reports for the dates listed

below:

May 2008 - Week 2
Wednesday  5/7/2008

Thursday 5/8/2008
Friday 5/9/2008
Saturday 5/10/2008

May 2008 - Week 3

Sunday
Monday
Tuesday
Wednesday
Thursday
Friday
Saturday

5/11/2008
5/12/2008
5/13/2008
5/14/2008
5/15/2008
5/16/2008
5/17/2008

May 2008 - Week 4

Sunday
Monday
Tuesday
Wednesday
Thursday
Friday
Saturday

5/18/2008
5/19/2008
5/20/2008
5/21/2008
5/22/2008
5/23/2008
5/24/2008

If you have any questions or concerns please don’t hesitate to call me at: 303 825-2777.

Sincerely,

-

Lokelani F. Narte

Enclosures
In/s

Z:\Memos\C\Carol Daniels\May 27.doc

RECEIVED
MAY 30 2008
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

600 Seventeenth Street | Telephone 303.825.2777
Suite 1900 South Facsimile 303.825.2790
Denver, CO 80202 www.baytex.ab.ca



BAYTEX

ENERGY USA LTD

CON W!DHN’MAI@

WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT
Well Name: Devil Mesa 1-13 API #: 43-037-318790000 Division: Denver
Field: Wildcat Well Type: Exploration -Property #:
County, State: San Juan, UT Spud Date: Water Depth:
KG/GL Elev: 6,133 est/ 6,118 Last CSG Size: WI %: 88.89
TD TVD/MD 6,365 /6,581 Shoe TVD/MD
Location: Section 13, T36S, R23E, SENW, 1522 FNL & 2419 FWL
Format:_Scction, TS, RNG, Qu/Qtr, FSL/FNL & FEL/FWL

AFE #: 07031788 Operator: Baytex Energy USA Description: Drill & Complete
AFE Total: $1,395,620 Rig Name: Patterson #747 Start Date:  4/17/2008
DHC/CWC: $978,191/ $417,429 Rig Contr: Patterson - UTI Release Date:
Report Date: 51/2008 Report By: Dave Friesen
Daily Drilling Costs: Completion: Daily Total: $4,771
Cum Drilling Costs: Completion: Well Total:  $70,388.00
Current MD: Current TVD: Progress:
Activity Report

Start End Hrs Activity Description:

6:30

Move-In, Rig-Up




BAYTEX

ENERGY USA LTD

d‘tm« um 'TIAL

WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT
Well Name: Devil Mesa 1-13 APL#: 43-037-318790000 Division: Denver
Field: ' Wildeat Well Type: Exploration Property #:
County, State: San Juan, UT Spud Date: Water Depth:
KG/GL Elev: 6,133 est/ 6,118 Last CSG Size: WI %: 88.89
TD TVD/MD 6,365 /6,581 Shoe TVD/MD
Location: Section 13, T36S, R23E, SENW, 1522 FNL & 2419 FWL
Format:_Scction, TS, RNG. Qu/Qtr. FSL/ENL. & FEL/FWL
AFE #: 07031788 Operator: Baytex Energy USA Description: Drill & Complete
AFE Tota!: $1,395,620 Rig Name: Patterson #747 Start Date:  4/17/2008
DHC/CWC: $978,191/ $417,429 Rig Contr: Patterson - UTT Release Date:
_Report Date: 5/8/2008 Report By: ~ Dave Friesen
Daily Drilling Costs: - Completion: Daily Total: $4,771
Cum Drilling Costs: © Completion: Well Total:  $145,401
Current MD: Current TVD: Progress:
Activity Report
Start End Hrs Activity Description:
6:30 Moving -In (05-08_08)

Currently Rigging-Up

(expect to spud late tonight or early morning)



BAYTEX

ENERGY USA LTD

WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT
Well Name: Devil Mesa 1-13 APL #: 43-037-318790000 Division: Denver
Field: Wildcat Well Type: Exploration Property #:
County, State: San Juan, UT Spud Date: Water Depth:
KG/GL Elev: 6,133 est/ 6,118 Last CSG Size: WI %: 88.89
TD TVD/MD 6,365 /6,581 Shoe TVD/MD
Location: Section 13, T36S, R23E, SENW, 1522 FNL & 2419 FWL
Formut: Sceiion. TS, RNG. Qur/Qtr, FSL/INL & FEL/FWL
AFE i 07031788 Operator: Baytex Energy USA Description: Drill & Complete
AFE Total: $1,395,620 Rig Name: Patterson #747 Start Date:  4/17/2008
DHC/CWC: $978,191/ $417,429 Rig Confr: Patterson - UTI Release Date:
Report Date: 5/8/2008 Report By: Dave Friesen
Daily Drilling Costs:  $30,011 Completion: Daily Total: $30,011
Cum Drilling Costs: $175,412 Completion: Well Total: $175,412
Current MD: Current TVD: Progress:
Activity Report
Start End Hrs Activity Description:
6:30 24 Moving -In (05-07-08)
6:30 24 Rigging-Up to spud (05-08-08)
6:30 Currently Driiling rat and mouse hole, should be spudding later this morning,




BAYTEX

ENERGY USA LTD

1AL

WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT
Well Name: Devil Mesa 1-13 APl #: 43-037-318790000 Division: Denver
Field: Wildcat Well Type: Exploration Property #:
County, State: San Juan, UT Spud Date: Water Depth:
KG/GL Elev: 6,133 est/ 6,118 Last CSG Size: WI %: 88.39
TD TVD/MD 6,365 / 6,581 Shoe TVD/MD
Location: Section 13, T36S, R23E, SENW, 1522 FNL & 2419 FWL
Format: Section. TS, RNG. Qur/Qtr. FSL/FNL & FEL/FWL
AFE #: 07031788 ' Operator: Baytex Energy USA  Description: Drill & Complete
AFE Total: $1.395,620 Rig Name: Patterson #747 Start Date:  4/17/2008
DHC/CWC: $978,191/ $417.429 Rig Contr: Patterson - UTT Release Date:
Report Date: 5/12/2008 Report By: Dave Friesen
Daily Drilling Costs: WO Revised costs Completion: Daily Total: WO Report
Cum Drilling Costs: Completion: Well Total:
Current MD: 2157 Current TVD: 2157 Progress:
Activity Report
Start End Hrs Activity Description:
7-May-08 Moving -In
8-May-08 Rigging-Up
18:30 9-May-08 Rig up, spud well at 20:30 H, Drill ahead {/ 72 *- 589', no hole problems
18:30 10-May-08 Drill ahead 11" surface hole from 589'-1513', no hole problems

11-May-08 Drill ahead f/ 1513' - 2175’ (proposed surface TD)




DAILY DRILLING REPORT

CONFIDENTIAL

REeporL For . - Jave rriesen

Baytex Energy USA Ltd
p;ELL: Devil Mesa 1-13

REPORT# 7 | DATE: 13/05/08
[Depth@24:00: 2178  mKB | _PROGRESS: 0 fi in rotating hours (fast 24 hours)
[floper@os:00:  Picking up HWDP FOReMAN:  TJ Blacquier MOBILE NO.: 403-548-1227
by cosT: $29,101 |HOLE CND.: good WEATHER: rain TOOLPUSH:  Jeff Peters
[loum cosr: $452,571 |riG/RiG#:  Patterson 747 TEMP.: 60 T.P.MOBILE: 505-486-6812
lirormATION: |KB. ELEV.: 6133.0 ROADS: muddy Geologist of|
((BIT PERFORMANCE | SURVEYS DRILLING FLUID  [PUMPS ]
1 kieptn{mkb} inc Azmuth  [fTime #1 #2
77/8 Depth(ft) Omega Omega
United Density /ppg L-750 L-750
uD513 Mud Grad 0.00 6.5X8" 6.5X8"
Is sec/qrt
0.00 0.00
P Ib/100ft2 95% 95%
psi
0 ft/sec
L (cc's) 0 ft/sec
Filter Cake 0 ft/sec
Sand (%) [MUD & CHEMICALS
Solids (%) ud Cycle 0 min
0 0 Mud Co. 0 Bottoms Up 0 min
#DIV/0! | #DIV/0! anks/Pits 600  bbi's
ole Volume bbl's
IBOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY TYPE OD /15(in) LENGTH [sugwixtoo0] 1105 Jisystem Vol. 600  bbi's
TYPE OD/ID(in) | LENGTH Avall WOB: [IMud & Chemicais Added:
JtsDP in hole:
JtsDP on reks: 252
DP on Loc: 252
DP Conn: 4.5"XH
DC Conn: __4.5XH
BHA Length: [WELL CONTROL _ |[Mud Daily Cost $360
||DRILLING OPERATIONS TIME BREAKDOWN Jioss circ " [IMud cum Cost $3,004
RU & TO Stip and cut DST RSPP-SPM [[SOLIDS CONTROL
Drill Actual Survey Fishing CP(psi) [lshaker Make Derrick
eaming Logging Direct. Work  Hole Fill [lshaker Mesh 140 x 80
ring Run Casing Weld bowl 51/2 Hole Fill Centrifuge |Centrifuge#2
m Rathole Cementing 2 |R/M Hole | st BOP Dirill: ol UF (gpm)
ond / Circ wocC 4 Safety Mig 1/2  |[Dayights U.F. (ppg)
ripping 11/2 |NuBOPS 51/2 |Hs2Dr raveyards .F. (ppg)
bricate Rig Test BOPs 5 Lst Sfty Mtg 13/05/08 |Hours/Days
Repair Rig Drill Out Cmt Total Hrs 24 ety Topic | cementing |[Boiler Hrs: (to 24:00)
[24 HOUR SUMMARY report for: Tuesday May 13,2005 .
Cemented casing with 380sks{198bbls} of PRB lI{11.5lbm/ft} w/ .125/lbm polyflake,tailed in 120sks{38.5bblis} of PRB I
{13.5lbm/ft} w/ .125/Ibm polyflake.Plug down at 13/05/08-02:00hrs,with 50bbis returns.Waited on cement.Nippled down
BOP's.Cut conductor,casing and welded on bowl.Headed up BOP's.Pressure test Bop's and related equipment as per UOGC
regulations.Ran in 6 1/4" Dc's and 12 stands DP to laydown.
Note : Plug down 13/05/08 at 02//;00hrs,50bbls good returns
: All pressure test conducted to low 250 and a high 2000 psi,as per UOGC regulations with pressure truck
: Jeff Brown of BLM on location for BOP pressure test
Operations @ 14/05/08-06:00 hrs - Picking up HWDP




P

Baytex Energy USA Lid

1616 - 17th Street, Suite #600
Denver, Colorado, 80202

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Ofiice: 435-825-2777
Fax: 303-825-2790

WELL NAME Devil Mesa 1-13 DATE 13-May-2008
JUNIQUE WELL ID 43-037-31879-0000 DAY NO. 7
|prROJECT Gas Well AFE # 7031788
|Site Supervisor Terry Blacquier 403 548 5570 Start Depth 2178.0
I_R_ig Manager Jeff Peters | 505 486 6812 End Depth 2178.0
Contractor - Rig # Patterson 747 Daily Progress 0.0
ILlcense 43-037-
31879-0000 AVG ROP #DIV/0!
ILease & road condition _ Temp 53
From |To Time Code Detailed Description of Daily Operations
6:00 2:00 2.00 12 Cement casing with Halliburton
2:00 6:00 4.00 13 Wait on cement
6:00 8:00 2.00 14 Nipple down BOP
8:00 14:00 6.00 21 Cut conductor and casing,Welded on bowl
14:00 17:30 3.50 14 |Head up BOP's B
17:30 22:30 5.00 15 Pressure test BOP's & related equiment with press testing truck
22:30 0:00 1.50 6 Ran in DC's and 12 DP to lay down B
0:00
Operations 00:00 to 06:00 May 14/08
0:00 3:30 3.50 6 Ran in DC's and 12 DP to lay down
3:30 4:00 0.50 7 Rig Service
4:00 6:00 2.00 21 Make up Directional tools,mwd
6:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
30.00
[Pumps - #1 - Omega -750, #2 - Omega -750 - GPS @ 91 _ Strokes 0 1 ,SOLID_S CONTROL EQUIPMENT
-6 Liner@2.7a/s  #2-6" Liner @ 2.7g/s gpm __|ishaker Make| Derrick
|Pump Pressure (Air) psi haker Mesh
|RrotaryrwoB Desander  |Desitter Centifuge #1 |Centifuge #2
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE (Water) 600 BBL Volume gpm
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE 0 BBL O.F
IFLUIDS IN TANKS 680 BBL UF
Mud Weight | Viscosity ~ hrs
o B S o 24 Hour Look Ahead o _
Fuel on Hand 2650 gallons _ JPick up HWDP and directional tools.Run in drill out
IFuel Delivered Today gallons Jcement.Drilled 7 7/8" hole as per directional program.
[Surveys Depth Inclination
j _LastBOPTest ~
) L Daily | Accum DAILY TOTAL $29,101
Rig Hours From Spud: 24 120 PREVIOUS TOTAL $423,470
Rotating Hours __ 0.00 34.00 CUMULATIVE TOTAL $452,571
- SUPERVISOR: _Terry Blacquier _ _PROJECTED AFETOTAL | $969,973
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| DAILY DRILLING REPORT  § CONFIDENTIAL
Baytex Energy USA Ltd Report For: Dave Friesen
fweLL: Devil Mesa 1-13 REPORT #: 9 | pate 15/05/08
||Depth@24:00: 3453 mKB I PROGRESS: 943 m in 16 1/2  rotating hours (last 24 hours)
[loper@os:00:  Drilling ahead at 3622' FOREMAN: _ TdJ Blacquier MOBILENO.:  403-548-1227
[baLy cosT: $41,076 HOLE CND.: _good WEATHER: cloudy TOOLPUSH: __ Jeff Peters
|@M COST: $548,399 RIG/RIG# Patterson 747 TEMP.: 64 T.P.MOBILE:  505-486-6812
[lFormaTiON: Culter K.B. ELEV.: 6133.00 ROADS: good Geologist Bob Gould
[IBIT PERFORMANCE SURVEYS DRILLING FLUID [PuMPS
1 Idepth{mkb} inc Azmuth |[Time 12;00 [lPump No. #1 #2
77/8 2772 12.90° 101.9 ||Depth(ft) 2990 (make Omega Omega
United 2899 17.00° 100.7 [{Density /ppg 8.40 [Model L-750 L-750
UD513 2962 18.40° 100.2 |[Mud Grad 0.44  [lunerX stk 6.5X8" 6.0X8"
4332 3089 21.00° 98.7 Is seciqnt 27 SPM 120
5x18/2x14 3152 22.00° 98.6 PV 1 Pump Rate 311 0
2178 3215 23.70° 98 P Ib/100ft2 1 Pump Ei. 95% 95%
3453 3278 24.50° 96.3 [Gels Pump Press. 975  psi
19 3/4 3152 22.00° 98.6 (pH 9.0 Drillpipe AV 55 ft/sec
20 3215 23.70° 98 L {cc's) Drillcoflar AV tt/'sec
motor 3278 24.50° 96.3  [[Fiiter Cake Nozzle Vel 64 ft/sec
3374 26.40° 92.2 [Isand (%) IMUD & CHEMICALS
3437 26.40° 90.3 [Isolids (%) Mud Cycle 96 min
1275 3562 25.40° 94 Mud Co Bariod  [[Bottoms Up 37 min
64.6 3624 26.40° 94 Mud Man C Tippetts  [[Tanks 400  bbi's
19 3/4 Mud Up @ 0 Hole Volume 311 bbl's
BOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY TYPE OD/1D(in) LENGTH |gygwex1oo0| 85108  |isystem vol. 711 bbl's
TYPE OD/ID(n) | LENGTH Avail WOB: 25000 [[Mud & Chemicals Added:
Bit 77/8 1.00 JtsDP in hole: 72 Sawdust 5
Motor| 61/2 27.74 JtsDP on reks: 179 Soda ash 2
UBHO 61/2 3.00 DP on loc: 251 Lime 1
NMDC| 6 5/16 60.40 DP Conn: 4.5"XH
HWDP 41/2 920.73 DG Conn: 4.5"XH
BHA Length: 1012.87 fi {WELL CONTROL Mud Daily Cost $761
DRILLING OPERATIONS TIME BREAKDOWN [loss circ viud cum Gost $4,619
RU & TO Slip and cut DST RSPP-SPM SOLIDS CONTROL
Drill Actual 17 1/2  |survey 4 Fishing MACP (psi) [ishaker Make Derrick
Reaming Logging Direct. Work alc Hole Fill Shaker Mesh 80 x80
Coring Run Casing Move Rig ct Hole Fill Centrifuge |Centrifuge
Rm Rathole Cementing RM Hole Lst BOP Drill: Vol UF (gpm)
(Cond / Gire WOC X/O Meeting 1/2 Daylights U.F. (ppg)
ripping NU BOP's Clean Tnk 11/2 raveyards O.F. (opg)
Lubricate Rig 1/2  [vestBOPs Sfty Mtg 15/05/08 |[Hours/Days
Repalr Rig Drill Out Cmt Total Hrs 24 afety Topic HeS arils  [|Boiler Hrs: {to 24:00)
{24 HOUR SUMMARY report for: May 15/08-06:00 to May 16/08 - 06:00hrs

Note : Pason PVT installed and working

Operations @ 16/05/08-06:00 hrs - Drilling ahead at 3622 ft

|[Directionally drilled 7 7/8" hole{2728-3139',surveying as required.Cleaned out Bos dewatering tank{solids].Directionally drilled
7 7/8" hole{3139-3622'}.surveying as required.




DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Baytex Energy USA Lid
|600 - 17th Street, Suite #1900 S Office: 435-825-2777
Denver, Colorado, 80202 Fax: 303-825-2790
WELL NAME Devil Mesa 1-13 DATE 15-May-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID 43-037-31879-0000 DAY NO. 9
PROJECT Gas Well AFE # 7031788
Site Supervisor Terry Blacquier 403 548 5570 Start Depth 2728.0
[Rig Manager Marshall Gallegos 505 486 6812 End Depth 3622.0
Contractor - Rig # Patterson 747 Daily 24hr Progress 894.0
WLicense 43-037-
31879-0000 AVG ROP 51.09
Lease & road condition Good dry [Weather Cloudy Temp 63
From |To Time Code Detailed Description of Daily Operations
6:00 6:30 0.50 7 Rig Service,crossover meeting
6:30 13:30 7.00 2 Directionally drill 7 7/8" hole {2728-3139'}
13:30 15:30 2.00 10 Accumulated Survey time
15:30 17:00 1.50 21 Cleaned out solids in Bos tank
17:00 18:00 1.00 2 Directionally drifl 7 7/8" hole{3139-3202'}
18:00 18:30 0.50 7 Rig Service,inspect Bop's
18:30 23:30 5.00 2 Directionally drill 7 7/8" hole {3202-3453"}
23:30 0:00 0.50 10 Accumulated Survey time
0:00 4:30 4.50 2 Directionally drill 7 7/8" hole {3453-3622"}
4:30 6:00 1.50 10 Accumulated Survey time
24.00 : :
Pumps - #1 - Omega -750, #2 - Omega -750 - GPS @ 9 Strokes 110 | SOLIDS CONTROL EQUIPMENT
#1- 6" Liner @ 2.7g/s ___ #2 - 6" Liner @ 2.7g/s 356 gpm___[iShaker Make Derrick Swaco
|Pump Pressure 950 psi Shaker Mesh 80 x80
IRotary/WOB 40 20000 Desander Desilter Centifuge #1 |Centifuge #2
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE (Water) 300 BBL [Volume gom
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE BBL O.F
JFLUIDS IN TANKS 900 BBL UF
Mud Welght |/ Viscosity 8.4 27 hrs
24 Hour Look Ahead
Fuel on Hand 1150 gallons _|Drilled 8.5" hole ahead and survey as required.
Fuel Delivered Today gallons
ISurveys Depth Inclination
|see directional survey.s
Last BOP Test _13/05/08
Daily Accum DAILY TOTAL $41,076
Rig Hours From Spud: 23 163 PREVIOUS TOTAL $507,323
Rotating Hours 17.50 63.50 CUMULATIVE TOTAL $548,399
SUPERVISOR: Terry Blacquier PROJECTED AFE TOTAL $989,973




CONFIDENTIAL

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
Baytex Energy USA Ltd T o ave T ITSTI
EELL: Devil Mesa 1-13 REPORT #: 10 | opae 16/05/08
I pepth @0s:00: 3835 mKB | PROGRESS: 213 ft in 6 rotating hours (last 24 hours)
loperations @06:00 : Preparing to lay down derrick FOREMaN:  Td Blacquier MOBILENO.:  403-548-1227
[baiy cosr: $31,830 lHoLEcnp:  good WEATHER: lear TOOLPUSH: __ Jeff Peters
floum cosT: $580,723 lRic/RG#  Patterson 747 TEMP.: 15 T.P.MOBILE:  505-486-6812
ORMATION: Nang K.B. ELEV.: 6133.00 ROADS: ood Geologist Bob Gould
IBIT PERFORMANCE [ SURVEYS [DRILLING FLUID __ J[PUMPS
. 1 Hdeptn{mkb} inc Azmuth  |fTime ump No. #1 #2
77/8 3215 23.70° 98.0 ake Omega Omega
United 3278 24.5° 96.3 9.00 odel L-750 L-750
uD513 3374 27.6° 92.2 0.47 ner X Stk 6.5X8" 6.0X8"
4332 3437 26.4° 90.3 PM 120
5x18/2x14 3499 26.2° 94.2 Pump Rate 8.40 0.00
2178 3562 25.4° 94 Pump Eft. 95% 95%
3835 3624 26.4° 94 Pump Press. 7432  psi
351/2 3689 26.2° 94.2 Drillpipe AV 267 ft'sec
20 3785 25.7° 92.6 Drilicollar AV 268 f'sec
motor ozzle Vel 235 ftisec
MUD & CHEMICALS
rig repair ud Cycle 5 min
1657 0 Bariod  |[Bottoms Up 0 min
46.7 0 anks 42 bbl's
351/2 . 0 ole Volume 0 bbl's
BOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY TYPE [ OD/D() | LENGTH [sygwixiooo] 85108 |lsystem Vol 42 pbrs
TYPE OD/iD(in) | LENGTH Avail WOB: 25000 [iMud & Chemicals Added:
Bit| 77/8 1.00 JtsDP In hole: 196 Ciderfiber 4
Motor| 6 1/2 27.74 JtsDP on rcks: 55 Pac R 1
UBHO 61/2 3.00 DP on Loc: 251 ime 1
NMDC| 6 5/16 60.40 DP Conn: 4.5"XH
HWDP 41/2 920.73 DC Conn: | 4.5"XH
BHA Length: | 1012.87 ft iIWELL CONTROL  |[Mud Daily Cost $365
||DRILLING OPERATIONS TIME BREAKDOWN Jloss circ [IMud cum Cost $5,478
RU & TO 4 Slip and cut DST RSPP-SPM [[SOLIDS CONTROL
Drill Actual 6 Survey Fishing MACP(psi) Derrick
Reaming Logging Direct. Work 1 c Hole Fill 80 x80
oring Run Casing |Move Rig ct Hole Fill Centrifuge |Centrifuge
m Rathole Cementing R/M Hole Lst BOP Drill:
ond / Circ woc Safety Mtg Dayiights
ripping 51/2 |nuBoPs WO Orders 71/2 raveyards
bricate Rig Test BOPs Lst Sfty Mtg 02/08/05 |[Hours/Days 1
Repair Rig Drill Out Cmt Total Hrs 24 oty Topic H2S drills l_BoiIer Hrs: (to 24:00)
4 HOUR SUMMARY report for: May 16/08-06:00 to May 17/08 - 06:00hrs
Directionally drilled 7 7/8" hole{3622-3835'},surveying as required.Waited on orders/rig inspector{bent derrick leg/sub settling
mud tanks side}.Laid down pipe.Rigged out floor,prepare to lay down derrick for repairs.
Note : Rig inspector apporved, lying down pipe and derrick for repairs
: we will also repair ground{wash out} around sub while fixing derrick leg
Operations @ 04/08/03-06:00 hrs - Repairing derrick leg,and




DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Baytex Energy USA Lid
600 - 17th Street, Suite #1900 S Office: 435-825-2777
Denver, Colorado, 80202 Fax: 303-825-2790
WELL NAME Devil Mesa 1-13 DATE 16-May-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID #REF! DAY NO. 10
|PROJECT Gas Well AFE # 7031788
Isite Supervisor Terry Blacquier 403 548 5570 Start Depth 3622.0
Ilﬂg Manager Marshall Gallegos 505 486 6812 End Depth 3835.0
Contractor - Rig # Patterson 747 Daily Progress -213.0
ILIcense 43-037-
31879-0000 AVG ROP 35.50
|Lease & road condition _ good dry Weather clear Temp 70
From |To Time Code Detailed Description of Daily Operations
6:00 12:00 6.00 2 Directionally drill 7 7/8" hole {3622-38357}
12:00 19:30 7.50 21 Wait on orders {bent derrick leg/sub setteling mudtank side}
19:30 1:00 5.50 6 Laid down pipe B
1:00 2:00 1.00 23 Serviced and laid down directional tools
2:00 6:00 4.00 1 Rig down floor{ prepare to lay down derrick
6:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
) 24.00
[Pumps - #1 - Omega -750, #2 - Omega -750 - GPS @94 Strokes 110 | SOLIDS CONTROL EQUIPMENT
j#1-6"Liner@2.7g/s  #2-6" Liner @ 2.7g/s 356 gpm___|IShaker Make] Swaco Swaco
IPump Pressure (Air) 1189 psi haker Mesh
IRotary/WOB 55 24000 ] Desander | Desilter Centifuge #1 [Centifuge #2
[TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE (Water) 686 BBL Volume gpm
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE 8.6 BBL O.F
JFLUIDS IN TANKS 42 BBL U.F
Mud Weiht / Viscosity 10 9 ‘hrs
24 Hour Look Ahead
Fuel on Hand 3050 gallons Fi?pair derrick and dirt around sub.Rig equipment back up.Fick
IFuel Delivered Today 2000 gallons |directiopal tools.Run in with bit.Drilled 8.5" hole ahead and survey
las require.
ISurveys - _ Depth | Inclination
Isee above directional survey's
Last BOP Test | 13/05/08 ,
o Daily Accum | DAILY TOTAL $31,830
Rig Hours From Spud: _ 24 186 PREVIOUS TQTAL $548,893
Rotating Hours 6.00 | 73.00 CUMULATIVE TOTAL $580,723
SUPERVISOR: __Terry Blacquier _ PROJECTED AFE TOTAL _ $989,973
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DAILY DRILLING REPORT | cONFIDENTIAL

Baytex Energy USA Lid Report For: Dave Friesen

weLL: Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 REPORT #: 11 | oaE 17/05/08
Depth @06:00 : 3835 mKB | PrROGRESS: 0ft in rotating hours (last 24 hours)

Operations @06:00 : Preparing to rig back up Foreman:  TJ Blacguier MOBILENO.:  403-548-1227
(bArLy cosT: $25,105 HOLE CND.: good WEATHER: Clear TOOLPUSH: _ Jeff Peters
floum cosr: $621,057 RIG/RIG#  Patterson 747 TEMP.: 72 TP.MOBILE:  505-486-6812
[FormaTION: Culter K.B. ELEV.: 6130.00 ROADS: dry Geologist Bob Gould
(BIT PERFORMANCE SURVEYS DRILLING FLUID [[PUMPS

Idepth{mkb} inc Azmuth  [ITime 8:00 Pump No. #1 #2
3835  [lmake Omega Omega
8.40 |modei L-750 L-750
0.44 Liner X Stk 6.5X8" 6.0X8"
27 PM
1 Pump Rate 0.00
1 Pump Eff. 95% 95%
11 Pump Press. psi
10.0  |[prilpipe AV 0 ft/sec
20 Drilcollar AV 0 ftisec
Nozzle Vel 0 ft/sec
[MUD & CHEMICALS
0.9% |Mud Cycle 0 min
0 0 Bariod Bottoms Up 0 min
#DIV/0! C Tippetts  |[Tanks 480 bbl's
0 Hole Volume 0 bbl's
BOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY TYPE OD/1D(n) LENGTH sty Wt x 1000 llsystem vor. 480 bbl's
TYPE 0D /1D(in) LENGTH Avail WOB: Mud & Chemicals Added:
JtsDP in hole:
JtsDP on reks: 251
DP on Loc: 251
DP Conn: 4.5"XH
DC Conn: 4.5°XH
BHA Length: 0.001#t [IWELL CONTROL Mud Daily Cost $365

DRILLING OPERATIONS TIME BREAKDOWN [loss circ Mud Cum Cost $5,843

RU & TO 6 Slip and cut DST RSPP-SPM SOLIDS CONTROL

Drill Actual Survey Fishing MACP(psi) |lshaker Make Derrick

Reaming Logging Direct. Work Calc Hole Fill - Shaker Mesh 80 x80

oring Run Casing Excavate dirt wik 6 ct Hole Fill Centrifuge |Centrifuge
Rm Rathole Cementing WO D-Light 91/2 |Lst BOP Drili: Vol UF (gom)

ond / Gire WOGC Safety Mtg Daylights U.F. (ppg)

Tipping NU BOP's WO Hoe 2172 Graveyards O.F. (ppg)

Lubricate Rig Test BOPs Sfty Mtg 17/05/08 [[Hours/Days

Repair Rig Drill Out Cmt Total Hrs 24 fety Topic rig move _[Boiler Hrs: {to 24:00)
(24 HOUR SUMMARY report for: May 17/08-06:00 to May 18/08 - 06:00hrs

Rigged down derrick and sub to repair bent derrick leg and repair washout around substructre.Waited on trackhoe to excavate

around wellhead.Excavate around wellhead and put dry fill dirt. Wated on daylight/trucks to rig back up,

Note : Derrick leg repaired by Dakota Rig Services{Jerry Carr} will forward report to us

: major washout under rig matting,around rathole,excavated and back filled with dry fill & road base

Operations @05/08/05-06:00 hrs - Preparing to rig back up
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DAILY DRILLING REPORT [ CONFIDENTIAL ]
Baytex Energy USA Lid
600 - 17th Street, Suite #1900 S Office: 435-825-2777
Denver, Colorado, 80202 Fax: 303-825-2790
WELL NAME Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 DATE 17-May-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID 43-037-31879-0000 DAY NO. 11
IPROJECT Gas Well AFE # 7031788
ISIte Supervisor Terry Blacquier 403 548 5570 ' Start Depth 3835.0
II_R_IQ Manager Marshall Gallegos 505 486 6812 End Depth 3835.0
Contractor - Rig # Patterson 747 , Daily Progress 0.0
lLIcense 43-037-
31879-0000 ) AVG ROP #DIV/0!
Lease & road condition dry & good |Weather | clear Temp 72
From [To Time Code Detailed Description of Daily Operations
6:00 12:00 6.00 1 Rig down derrick {to repir bent derrick leg} and excavate wash out around
sub
12:00 14:30 2.50 23 Wait on track hoe to dig out dirt around well head
14:30 20:30 6.00 21 Excavate around wellhead & put dry fill back in
20:30 6:00 9.50 22 Wait on daylight

Washout under rig matting,rathole excavated & back filled with dry dirt &
road base.Derrick leg repairs done by Dakota Rig Service,Inspector Jerry

Carr will forward report.

24.00
|pumps - #1 - Omega -750, #2 - Omega -750 - GPS @ 97 Strokes | SOLIDS CONTROL EQUIPMENT
|#-6"Liner@2.70/s  #2-6" Liner @ 2.7g/s gom___[iShaker Make Swaco Swaco
Pump Pressure psi haker Mesh
Rotary/WOB ] Desandér  |Desilter Centifuge #1 [Centifuge #2
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE (Water) 0 BBL Volume gpm
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE 0 BBL O.F
JFLUIDS IN TANKS 800 BBL UF
[Mud Weight / Viscosity hrs
) _ ) _ _ 24 Hour Look Ahead
|Fuel on Hand 2900 gallons JRig back up.Pick up make up directional tools.Pick up HWDP and
|Fuel Delivered Today galions |pipe.Run in with bit.Drilled 7 7/8" hole ahead and survey as
- Jrequired.
Isurveys Depth Inclination
__ Last BOP Pressure Tést o 13/05/08
| Daily | Accum DAILY TOTAL $25,105
Rig Hours From Spud: 0 | 174 PREVIOUS TOTAL -$595,952
Rotating Hours 1 0.00 73.00 CUMULATIVE TOTAL $621,057
SUPERVISOR: @ ) _Terry Blacquier | PRQJEG‘,[E_Q,AFE TOTAL |  $989,973




. ) YW b THEYE B )
DALY DRILLING REPORT | CONFIDENTIAL |}
Baytex Energy USA Ltd N e
[weLL: Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 REPORT #: 12 | oaE 18/05/08
| Depth @06:00 : 3835 mKB | PROGRESS: 0 ft in rotating hours (last 24 hours)
lloperations @os:00 : Picking up pipe and tripping in FOREMAN: TJ Blacquier MOBILE NO.: 403-548-1227
ALY cosT: $35,105 [HOLE oND.: good WEATHER: clear TOOLPUSH:  Jeff Peters
[lcum cosr: $656,162 IRiG/RIG#: _ Patterson 747 TEMP.: 75 T.P.MOBILE: 505-486-6812
FORMATION: Culter K.B. ELEV.: 6130.00 ROADS: good Geologist Bob Gould
[BIT PERFORMANCE [ SURVEYS [DRILLING FLUID [PumMPS
it No. 2 kdepth{mkb} inc Azmuth  [fTime Pump No. #1 #2
77/8 Make Omega Omega
United 8.40 |vode! L-750 L-750
UD513 0.44  [lfLiner X Stk 6.5X8" 6.0X8"
3609 PM
Pump Rate 0.00 0.00
Pump Eff. 95% 95%
Pump Press. psi
10.0  ||prilipipe AV 0 ft/sec
Drilicollar AV 0 ft/sec
Nozzle Vel 0 ft/sec
{(MUD & CHEMICALS
Mud Cycle 0 min
0 0 Bariod Bottoms Up 0 min
#DIV/0! 0 anks 35 bbl's
0 Hole Volume 0 bbl's
[BOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY TYPE OD/1D(in) LENGTH  |strg wt x 1000 lisystem voi. 35 bbl's
TYPE OD/ID(in) | LENGTH Avail WOB: [IMud & Chemicals Added:
Bitf 77/8 1.00 JtsDP in hole:
Motor|  61/2 27.74 JtsDP on reks: 251
UBHO 61/2 3.00 DP on Loc: 251
NMDC| 6 5/16 60.40 DP Conn: 4.5°XH
HWDP 41/2 920.73 DG Conn: _4.5"XH
BHA Length: 1012.87 ft ||WELL CONTROL Mud Daily Cost $365
||DRILLING OPERATIONS TIME BREAKDOWN [loss circ {iMud Cum Cost $6,208
RU & TO 11 1/2  |stipand cut DST RSPP-SPM [lSOLIDS CONTROL
Drill Actual Survey Fishing CP(psi) Derrick
eaming Logging Direct. Work 2 alc Hole Fill 80 x80
ring Run Casing |Move Rig ct Hole Fill Centrifuge |Centrifuge
Rm Rathole Cementing Excavate dirt wrk BOP Drill:
ond / Circ woc Safety Mig 31/2 |payights
ripping 41/2 |NuBOPs Move Pipe 21/2 raveyards
ubricate Rig Test BOPs t Sfty Mtg 18/05/08 |{Hours/Days
Repalr Rig Drill Out Cmt Total Hrs 24 afety Topic general__{|Boiler Hrs: (to 24:00)
i24 HOUR SUMMARY report for: May 18/08-06:00 to May 19/08 - 06:00hrs
Back filled and leveled around wellhead with roadbase/gravel.Spotted matting and leveled sub.Spotted and leveled carrier/
derrick.Rigged up floor nd giude lines.Rigged up flow line/manifold lines,Spotted racks,moved HWDP and straped.Picked up
and made up directional tools{function tested}.Picked up and ran in HWDP and DP.Moved pipe to racks and strapped.Picked
up and ran in DP.
IlOperatIons @ 06/07/05-06:00 hrs - Picking up DP and running in hole
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600 - 17th Street, Suite #1900 S

Baytex Energy USA Lid

DAILY-DRILEING-REPORT

Office: 435-825-2777

Denver, Colorado, 80202 Fax: 303-825-2790
WELL NAME Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 DATE 18-May-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID 43-037-31879-0000 DAY NO. 12
[PROJECT Gas Well AFE # 7031788
ISIte Supervisor Terry Blacquier 403 548 5570 Start Depth 3835.0
Im Manager Marshall Gallegos 505 486 6812 End Depth 3835.0
Contractor - Rig # Patterson 747 Daily Progress 0.0
ILIcense 43-037-
31879-0000 [H2S Possible below 10,800 AVG ROP #DIV/0!
Lease & road condition Temp 53
From |To Time Code Detailed Description of Daily Operations
6:00 9:30 3.50 21 Back filled and leveled road base/gravel around wellhead
9:30 11:00 1.50 1 Spot matting/sub
11:00 12:30 1.50 1 Spot & level rig carrier/ralse derrick
12:30 19:00 6.50 1 Rig up floor/guide wires
19:00 21:00 2.00 1 Rig in flow line/manifold lines
21:00 22:00 1.00 23 Spot racks,moved pipe and strap
22:00 0:00 2.00 20 Pick up/made up directional tools& function test
0:00 3:30 3.50 6 Pick up/made up HWDP & DP
3:30 5:00 1.50 23 Move pipe to racks & strap
5:00 6:00 1.00 6 Pick up DP & run in
6:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
2400
JPumps - #1 - Omega -750, #2 - Omega -750 - GPS @ 9| Strokes I SOLIDS CONTROL EQUIPMENT o
|#1 - 6" Liner @ 2.7g/s #2 - 6" Liner @ 2.79/s gpm ||Shaker Make Swaco Swaco
Pump Pressure (Air) psi haker Mesh
Rotary/WOB ~ |Desander Desilter ~  [Centifuge #1 |Centifuge #2 |
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE (Water) BBL Volume gpm
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE BBL O.F
[FLUIDS IN TANKS 600 BBL UF
[Mud Weight / Viscosity 8.4 28 hrs
L _ o , , 24 Hour Look Ahead ] L
|Fuel on Hand 2550 gallons JRun in with bit.Drilled 7 7/8" hole ahead and survey as required
IFue! Delivered Today gallons
[Surveys Depth Inclination
Last BOP Pressure Test 13/05/08 _
] I o ___Dally Accum DAILY TOTAL $35,105
Rig Hours From Spud: 174.00 PREVIOUS TOTAL $621,057
i Rotating Hours 0.00 73.00 |  CUMULATIVE TOTAL $656,162
SUPERVISOR: Terry Blacquier - PROJECTED AFE TOTAL $989,973
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‘Wal bl &t Y A 4L %
DAILY DRILLING REPORT | CQNFIDENTIAL]
Baytex Energy USA Lid — il ,
IweLL: Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 REPORT# 13 | DATE: 19/05/08
I Depth @06:00 : 4716 mKB |  ProcRess: 881 ft in rotating hours (last 24 hours)
[loperations @06:00 : Drilling ahead at 4716 FOREMAN: TJ Blacguier MOBILE NO.: 403-548-1227
[loaiLy cost: $37,680 '|HoLE oND.: good WEATHER: clear TOOLPUSH: _ Jeff Peters
[lcum cosT: $696,342 lRG/RiG#  Patterson 747 TEMP.: 79 T.P. MOBILE: _505-486-6812
ORMATION: Culter K.B. ELEV.: 6130.00 ROADS: good Geologist Bob Gould
[BIT PERFORMANCE I SURVEYS |[DRILLING FLUID [PumPs
. 2 lidepth{mkb} inc Azmuth  [[Time 12;00 [|Pump No. #1 #2
77/8 3876 26.2° 3878 ake Omega Omega
United 3971 25.9° 8.40 odel L-750 L-750
UD513 4066 25.8° 0.44 iner X Stk 6.5X8" 6.0X8"
3609 4116 25.9° 27 PM 120
2x14/5x18 4256 25.9° 1 Pump Rate 8.40 0.00
3163 4350 25.7° 1 ump Efl. 95% 95%
11 Pump Press. 1,280 psi
85 Drilipipe AV 54 ft/sec
20 30 Drillcollar AV ftisec
50 ozzle Vel 64 ft/sec
[[MUD & CHEMICALS
0.6% ud Cycle 104 min
-3163 Bariod ottoms Up 50 min
#DIV/0! C Tippetts anks 350 bbl's
0 ole Volume 759 bbl's
[BOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY TYPE OB /1D{in) LENGTH Jswgwix1000] 83105 |lsystem Vol. 1109  bbl's
TYPE 0D/ ID(jn) LENGTH Avail WOB: 25000 [[Mud & Chemicals Added:
Bt 77/8 1.00 JtsDP in hole: 102
Motor| 61/2 27.74 JtsDP on reks: 149
UBHO| 6172 3.00 foP on Loc: 251
NMDC| 6 5/16 60.40 DP Conn: 4.5"XH
HWDP 41/2 920.73 DC Conn: 4.5"XH
BHA Length: 1012.87 ft |IWELL CONTROL [Mud Daily Cost $365
||DRILLING OPERATIONS TIME BREAKDOWN Jloss circ [(Mud Cum Cost $6,573
RU & TO Silp and cut DST RSPP-SPM ISOLIDS CONTROL
Drill Actual 16 Survey 2 Fishing MACP(psf) 791 Derrick
eaming Logging Direct. Work Calc Hole Fill 80 x80
oring Run Casing Move Rig ct Hole Fill Centrifuge |Centrifuge
m Rathole Cementing RM Hole BOPDril: | 21/05/08
ond / Circ 21/2 WOC Safety Mtg : Daylights
ripping 2 NU BOP's BOP drill Graveyards 21/05/08
bricate Rig 1 Test BOPs Sity Mg 21/05/08
epair Rig 1/2  |orii out Cmt Total Hrs 24 foty Topic general rB_(ﬁer Hrs: (to 24:00)
l24 HOUR SUMMARY report for:  May 20/08-06:00 to May 21/08 - 06:00hrs
Rigged serviced{function BOP's}.Picked up pipe and ran in.Picked up kellybroke circulation and washed to bottom{3642-3863'}
Drilled 7 7/8" hole{3863 - 4053'},surveying as required.Repaired rig{crown saver}.Drilled 7 7/8" hole{4053 - 4116%,surveying as
required.Rig serviced{function pipe rams},held BOP drill.Drilled 7 7/8" hole{4116 -47167},surveying as required.
Note : Depth correction made on trip in,wild single in string, corrected depth to 3863.06' from 3835'
Operations @ 21/05/08-06:00 hrs - Drilling ahead at 4716’
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DAILY DRILLING REPORT
Baytex Energy USA Lid
600 - 17th Street, Suite #1900 S Office: 435-825-2777
Denver, Colorado, 80202 Fax: 303-825-2790
WELL NAME Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 DATE 19-May-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID 43-037-31879-0000 ) DAY NO. 13
[PROJECT Gas Well AFE # 7031788
ISite Supervisor Terry Blacquier 403 548 5570 Start Depth 3835.0
IﬂlManager Marshall Gallegos 505 486 6812 End Depth 4716.0
Contractor - Rig # Patterson 747 Daily Progress 881.0
ILlcense 43-037-
31879-0000 AVG ROP 58.73
[Lease & road condition _ Temp 53
From |To Time Code Detailed Description of Daily Operations
6:00 6:30 0.50 7 Rig Serviced{ chcked BOP's}
6:30 8:30 2.00 6 Pick up DP & run in
8:30 11:00 2.50 5 Kelly up and washed to bottom {3642 to 3863'}
11:00 15:00 4.00 2 Drill 7 7/8" hole{3863 to 4053')
15:00 16:00 1.00 10 Accumulated survey time
16:00 16:30 0.50 8 Rig Repair {crown saver}
16:30 18:00 1.50 2 Drill 7 7/8" hole {4053 to 4116’}
18:00 18:15 0.25 7 Rig Serviced{ function pipe rams},
18:15 18:30 0.25 22 BOP Drill
18:30 5:00 10.50 2 Drill 7 7/8" hole {4116 to 4716"}
5:00 6:00 1.00 10 Accumulated survey time
6:00
0:00
0:00 Depth correction made on trip in 1 wild single in string
0:00 corrected depth to 3863.06"
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
24.00
[Pumps - #1 - Omega -750, #2 - Omega -750 - GPS @ 9] Strokes 120 | ) SOLIB§CONTROL EQUIPMENT
|1 -6"Liner@2.7q/s  #2-6" Liner @ 2.7g/s 356 gpm___[IShaker Make| Derrick Swaco
IPump Pressure (Air) 1189 psi _|JIShaker Mesh 80 x80
IRotarywoB 55 24000 - |Desander |Desiter  [Centifuge #1 [Centifuge #2
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE (Water) 210 BBL  [Volume gpm
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE BBL O.F
JFLUIDS IN TANKS 357 BBL U.F
IMud Weight / Viscosity 8.4 27 ~ hrs
] . ) o N .24 Hour Look Ahead o
|Fuel on Hand 1550 gallons [Drilled 7 7/8" hole ahead and survey as required.Mud up +-5000'|
IFuel Delivered Today gallons
[Surveys o | Depth Inclination
Isee above directional survey's
Last BOP Pressure Test 13/05/08 _
L o - Daily | Accum DAILY TOTAL $37,680
Rig Hours From Spud:_ ) a 13 187 PREVIOUS TOTAL $658,662
Rotating Hours 15.00 88.00 CUMULATIVE TOTAL $696,342
~ SUPERVISOR: o | Terry Blacquier PROJECTED AFE TOTAL $989,973
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DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Baytex Energy USA Lid Report For: Dave Friesen
[fwerc: Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 REPORT# 14 | DaTE:  20/05/08
t Depth @06:00 : 5438 mKB | PROGREss: 722 ft in 19 1/2_ rotating hours (last 24 hours)
[loperations @06:00 : Drilling ahead at 5438" FOREMAN: TJ Blacquier MOBILENO.:  403-548-1227
[bAwy cosT: $37,761 [HOLE cND.: good WEATHER: clear TOOLPUSH: __ Jeff Peters
lcum cosT: $736,818 lra/RiG# Patterson 747 TEMP.: 79 T.P.MOBILE:  505-486-6812
ORMATION: Hermosa K.B. ELEV.: 6130.00 ROADS: ood Geologist Bob Gould
|BIT PERFORMANCE SURVEYS ||DRILLING FLUID "PUMPS
i 2 depth{mkb} inc 13:00 . #1 #2
77/8 4729 23.1° 4987 Omega Omega
United 4824 22.7° 8.40 L-750 L-750
UD513 4918 21.1° 0.44 6.5X8" 6.0 X8"
3609 5013 21.5° 27 120
2x14/5x18 5106 21.3° 1 8.40 0.00
3163 5201 19.2° 1 95% 95%
4718 1,130  psi
8.0 81 ft'sec
20 ft/sec
50 95 filsec
EMICALS
ud Cycle 81 min
1555 ottoms Up 43 min
#DIV/0! anks 300 bbl's
ole Volume 882 bbl's
IBOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY TYPE OD /15(in) LENGTH  [sygwix1000| 1101Tbs | m Vol. 1182  bbl's
TYPE OD/ID(in) | LENGTH Avall WOB: 25000 |[Mud & Chemicals Added:
Bit| 77/8 1.00 JtsDP in hole: el 80 Sawdust 5
Motor 61/2 27.74 itsDP on rcks: 251 odaAsh 6 CederFiber 1
UBHO 61/2 3.00 DP on Loc 251 EZ Mud 4
NMDC| 6 5/16 60.40 DP Conn 4.5"XH alnut 7
HWDP 41/2 920.73 DC Conn 4.5"XH austic 1
BHA Length: 1012.87 it [WELL CONTROL __ |{Mud Daily Cost $1,346
IDRILLING OPERATIONS TIME BREAKDOWN ffoss cire [iMud Cum Cost $7.919
U&TO Stip and cut DST ISOLIDS CONTROL
rili Actual 19 1/2 |[survey 21/4 |Fishing Derrick
Reaming Logging Direct. Work 80 x80
ring Run Casing |Move Rig Centrifuge |Centrifuge
[Rm Rathole Cementing R/M Hole 21/05/08
ond / Circ 11/4 |woc Safsty Mig
ripping NU BOP's
bricate Rig 1 Test BOPs 20/05/08
Repair Rig Drill Qut Cmt Total Hrs 24 general Wer Hrs: (to 24:00)
[24 HOUR SUMMARY report for: May 20/08-06:00 to May 21/08 - 06:00hrs

Rig serviced,held crossover meeting.Drilled 7 7/8" hole{4716 - 5156',surveying as required.Rig serviced{function BOP's}.
Drilled 7 7/8" hole{5156 - 5355' },surveying as required.Conditioned mud.Drilled 7 7/8" hole{5355 - 5438’ },surveying as required.

Note : Mudded up at 5001"

Operations @ 21/05/08-06:00 hrs - Drilling ahead at 5438’
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: DAILY DRILLING REPORT
Baytex Energy USA Ltd
600 - 17th Street, Suite #1900 S Office: 435-825-2777
Denver, Colorado, 80202 Fax: 303-825-2790
WELL NAME Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 DATE 20-May-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID 43-037-31879-0000 DAY NO. 14
|PrROJECT Gas Well AFE # 7031788
Isite Supervisor Terry Blacquier 403 548 5570 Start Depth 4716.0
Img Manager Marshall Gallegos 505 486 6812 End Depth 5438.0
Contractor - Rig # Patterson 747 Daily Progress 722.0
ILIcense 43-037-
31879-0000 AVG ROP 37.03
Lease & road condition dry & good [Weather | clear Temp 79
From {To Time Code Detailed Description of Daily Operations
6:00 6:30 0.50 7 Rig Srevice {function test BOP's}
6:30 16:45 10.25 2 Drill 7 7/8" hole { 4716 to 5156}
16:45 18:00 1.25 10 Accummulated survey time
18:00 1:30 7.00 2 Drill 7 7/8" hole { 5156 to 5355}
1:30 2:45 1.25 5 Conditioned mud
2:45 5:15 2.50 2 Drill 7 7/8" hole { 5355 to 5438}
5:15
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 Note : mudded up at 5001'
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
, 22.75
Pumps - #1 - Qmega -750, #2 - Omeg_;a -750 - GPS @ 9] Strokes 120 | ~ SOLIDS CONTROL EQUIPMENT
|-6"Liner@2.7g/s  #2-6" Liner @ 2.7g/s 356 gpm___||Shaker Make] Derrick Swaco
|Pump Pressure 1130 psi Shaker Mesh 80 x80
IRotary/WOB 55 24000 ] ~ |Desander Desilter Centifuge #1 |Centifuge #2
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE (Water) 0 BBL Volume gpm
[TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE BBL O.F
JFLUIDS IN TANKS 800 BBL U.F
[Mud Weight / Viscosity 8.6 hrs 24 24
24 Hour Look Ahead o
|Fuel on Hand 800 gallons |Drilled 7 7/8" hole ahead and survey as required to core
{Fuel Delivered Today galions Jpoint.Circulate.Hoist to core
Surveys ~ Depth Inclination
Isee above directional survey's
Last BOP Pressure Test 13/05/08
Daily Accum DAILY TOTAL $37,761
_Rig Hours From Spud: _ 24 211 PREVIOUS TOTAL $699,057
_ Rotating Hours 19.50 107.50 CUMULATIVE TOTAL $736,818
SUPERVISOR: _Térry Blacquier PROJECTED AFE TOTAL ~ $989,973




s

Wali TEIRIINIEI'Y R §
DAILY DRILLING REPORT (\}(’Nl‘lnl‘a N l l 1‘]‘ |
Baytex Energy USA Lid R ————— =
IWELL: Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 REPORT# 15 | DATE: 21/05/08
[ Depth @os:00: 6134 mKB | PRoGREss: 696 ft in 21 1/4 _ rotating hours (last 24 hours)
loperations @06:00 : Circulating,preparing for short wiper trip  |Foreman:  TJ Blacquier MOBILENO..  403-548-1227
|lpaiy cosT: $51,779 |HOLE oND.: tight WEATHER:  Showers TOOLPUSH: Joff Peters
[fcum cosT: $794,596 |mG/riG#  Patterson 747 TEMP.: 65 T.P.MOBILE:  505-486-6812
FORMATION: Upper Isma K.B. ELEV.: 6130.00 ROADS: ood Geologist Bob Gould
BIT PERFORMANCE SURVEYS LI?RILLING FLUID [[PUMPS
Bit No 2 [tdepthimkb} inc Azmuth |Time 20:00 [fPump No. #1 #2
Size (in) 77/8 5295 16.9° 92.9 5590 |[make Omega Omega
Mfg. United 5390 15.6° 93.7 9 odel L-750 L-750
ype UD513 5486 14.0° 96.1 0.46  |Liner X stk 6.5X8" 6.0X8"
Serial # 3609 5580 12.2° 98.4 37 PM 75 75
Nozzles 2x14/5x18 5675 10.0° 93.8 5 Pump Rate 5.25 4.95
From (mKB) 3163 5770 8.8° 914 5.0 Pump Eff. 95% 95%
0 (MKB) 6175 5958 5.4° 104.9 512  |lPump Press. 1,330  psi
Hrs on Bit 57 10.0 [|lprilipipe AV 80 f/sec
OB (k/lbs) 20 11 Drillcollar AV ft/sec
RPM 50 1 Nozzle Vel 95 ft'sec
Condition 0.02 |[MUD & CHEMICALS
Pulled For? 1.7 Mud Cycle 83 min
Feet 3012 Bariod  |[Bottoms Up 49 min
r 52.8 C Tippetts [[Tanks 290 bbl's
Cum Hrs 57 1210 Hole Volume 597 bbl's
[BOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY TYPE [ OD/ID(n) | TENGTH [sugwix1o00] 130 1bS |lsystem Vo 897 bhis
TYPE OD/ID{in) | LENGTH Avail WOB: 25  |iMud & Chemicals Added:
Bitf 77/8 1.00 JtsDP in hole: 161 alnut 7 PacR 2
Motor| 61/2 27.74 JtsDP on rcks: 90 EZ Mud 3
UBHO 61/2 3.00 DP on Loc: 251 Gel 78
NMDC| 6 5/16 60.40 DP Conn: 45"°XH |Caustic 1
HWDP 41/2 920.73 DC Conn: 4.5°XH odaash 12
BHA Length: 1012.87 ft ||V_VELL CONTROL  |Mud Daily Cost $1,651
|DRILLING OPERATIONS TIME BREAKDOWN |[Coss circ JIMud Cum Cost $9,570
RU & TO Slip and cut DST RSPP-sPM | 3700@61 [[SOLIDS CONTROL
21 1/4  |survey 13/4 |rshing CP{psi) 39232 |lshaker Make Derrick
Logging Direct. Work c Hole Fill |lshaker Mesh 80 x80
Run Casing |Move Rig ct Hole Fill ) Centrifuge  |Centrifuge
Cementing R/M Hole t BOP Drill: | 21/05/08 [fvol UF (gpm)
WOC Safety Mtg 1/4  [lpayights U.F. (ppg)
NU BOP's Hold Press raveyards .F. (opg)
3/4  [vestBOPs t Sty Mtg 20/05/08 [Hours/Days 24 24
Drill Out Cmt Total Hrs 24 afety Topic | _general _|[Boiler Hrs: (to 24:00)
|24 HOUR SUMMARY report for: May 21/08-06:00 to May 22/08 - 06:00hrs

|Rig serviced,held crossover meeting.Drilled 7 7/8" hole{5438 - 5820',surveying as required.Rig serviced{function BOP's}.

Drilled 7 7/8" hole{5820 - 6134’ },surveying as required.

Operations @ 22/05/08-06:00 hrs - Circulating up sample, preparing for short wiper trip{25std}
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DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Baytex Energy USA Lid
{600 - 17th Street, Suite #1900 S Office: 435 220 0720
Denver, Colorado, 80202 Fax: 303-628-5547
WELL NAME Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 DATE 21-May-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID 43-037-31879-0000 DAY NO. 15
[prOJECT Gas Well AFE # 7031788
Eite Supervisor Terry Blacquier 435-220-0701 Start Depth 5438.0
I_I3i_g Manager Marshall Gallegos 505 486 6812 End Depth 6134.0
Contractor - Rig # Patterson 747 Daily Progress 696.0
|Llcense 43-037-
31879-0000 AVG ROP 33.14
Lease & road condition _ good __|Weather_| showers | Temp 85
From |[To Time Code Detailed Description of Daily Operations
6:00 6:30 0.50 7 Rig Serviced,crossover meeting
6:30 17:00 10.50 2 Drilled 7 7/8" hole{5428 to 5820'}
17:00 18:00 1.00 10 Accummulated survey time
18:00 18:30 0.50 7 Rig Serviced,crossover meeting
18:30 5:15 10.75 2 Drilled 7 7/8" hole{5428 to 5820'}
5:15 6:00 0.75 10 Accummulated survey time
6:00
0:00
24.00
[Pumps - #1 - 9P-100, #2 - FB-1300 - GPS @ 97% Strokes 75 | SOLIDS CONTROL EQUIPMENT
f#1-6" Liner @34 #2 - 6" Liner @ 4.28 425 gpm__[iShaker Make| Derrick Swaco
[Pump Pressure (Air) 1330 psi haker Mesh 80 x80
Rotary/WOB 55 2200 ~ |pesander [Desitter Centifuge #1 |Centifuge #2
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE (Water) 500 BBL [Volume gpm
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE BBL O.F
JFLUIDS IN TANKS 800 BBL U.F
[Mud Weight / Viscosity 8.9 37 hrs
ﬁ . 24 Hour Look Ahead
|Fuel on Hand gallons FDrilled 7 7/8" hole ahead and survey as required to core
|Fuel belivered Today 2500 gallons  Jpoint.Circulate.Hoist to core.R.IH with core barrel.
ISurveys Depth Inclination]
|see above directional survey's
B ~ Last BOP Test 13/05/08 —
‘ ] o Daily Accum DAILY TOTAL $51,779
_Rig Hours From Spud: 24 235 PREVIOUS TOTAL $742,818
Rotating Hours 21 1010 CUMULATIVE TOTAL $794,596
__SUPERVISOR: _| _ Terry Blacquier _ PROJECTED AFE TOTAL _ $989,973
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DAILY DRILLING REPORT | )NFIDENTIAL

Baytex Energy USA Lid Report For: Dave Friesen

WELL: Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 REPORT #: 16 | DATE: 22/05/08
Depth @06:00 : 6312 mKB | PRogress: 178 ft in 8 rotating hours (last 24 hours)

Operations @06:00 : Hoisting to core at 6312" FOREMAN:  TJ Blacquier MOBILENO..  403-548-1227
Ay cos: $40,936 HOLE OND.: good WEATHER: ___ showers TOOLPUSH: M Gallegos
lloum cosr: $824,938 RIG/RIG#  Patterson 747 TEMP.: 60 TP.MOBILE:  505-486-6812
llFormaTION: Ismay K.B. ELEV.: 6130.00 ROADS: good Geologist Bob Gould
[iBIT PERFORMANCE SURVEYS DRILLING FLUID [PumPS

2 depthimkb) inc Azmuth _ [[Time 13:00  |Pump No. #1 #2
77/8 6053 4.5° 94.0 ||Depth(ft) 6200 |[Make Omega Omega
United 6147 2.7° 97.3  [|Density /ppg 9 odel L-750 L-750
UD513 6242 0.7° 145 0.45  [fLiner x stk 6.5 X 8" 6.0X8"
3609 45 SPM 75 75
2x14/5x18 15 Pump Rate 5.25 4.95
3863 12 Pump EH. 95% 95%
6312 11/33  [lPump Press. 1,200  psi
65 9.0 Drilipipe AV 110 ft/sec
20 75 Drilicoliar AV ft/sec
50 1 Nozzls Vel 132 fi/sec
2-2-co-x--nd 0.4% [[MUD & CHEMICALS
core pt 2.7%  |Mud cyce 69 min
2449 0 Bariod  |[Bottoms Up 45 min
37.7 C Tippetts  [[Tanks 325 bbi's
65 5001 Hole Volume 667 bbl's
IBOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY TYPE OD/1D(in) LENGTH  laygwix1o00| 1351bs | System Vol. 992 bbl's
TYPE OD/ID(in) [~ LENGTH Avail WOB: 25000  [[Mud & Chemicals Added:
Bit| 77/8 1.00 JiSDP in hole: 166 PacR - 8 Walnut 12
Motor 61/2 27.74 JtsDP on rcks: 85 EZMud6  SodaAsh2
UBHO 61/2 3.00 DP on Loc: 251 Cal Carb 50
NMDC| 6 5/16 60.40 DP Conn: 45°XH ||Gel 63
HWDP 41/2 920.73 DC Conn: 4.5"XH [iBarite 25
BHA Length: 1012.87 ft {[WELL CONTROL [Mud Daily Cost $3,821
[DRILLING OPERATIONS TIME BREAKDOWN [loss circ Mud Cum Cost $15,342

RU & TO Slip and cut DST RSPP-SPM SOLIDS CONTROL
Drill Actual 8 Survey Fishing MACP(psi) 712 Shaker Make Derrick
Reaming Logging Direct. Work Calc Hole Fill haker Mesh 80 x80
[Coring Run Casing Move Rig Hole Fill Centrifuge |Centrifuge
Rm Rathole Cementing R/M Hole LstBOP Dril: | 22/05/08 [{vol UF (gpm)

Cond / Circ 8 woe Safety Mtg 1/2 Daylights U.F. (ppg)

Tripping 7 NU BOP's Graveyards ’O.F. )

Lubricate Rig 1/2 Test BOPs Lst Sty Mtg 22/05/08 [[Hours/Days
Repalr Rig Drill Out Gmt Total Hrs 24 fety Toplc general _|Boiler Hrs: (to 24:00)
24 HOUR SUMMARY report for: May 22/08-06:00 to May 23/08 - 06:00hrs

Circualed and condition mud.Wiper tripped 19 std's{1200'}.Circulated boitoms up.Controled drilled 7 7/8" hole{6134-6312',as

per geologist requested.{Core pint 6312".Circulated and conditioned mud{weight up 9.1ppg}.Hoisted to core.

Operations @ 23/05/08-06:00 hrs - Hoisting to core




DAILY DRILLING REPORT
Baytex Energy USA Ltd
600 - 17th Street, Suite #1900 S Office: 435-825-2777
Denver, Colorado, 80202 Fax: 303-825-2790
WELL NAME Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 DATE 22-May-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID 43-037-31879-0000 DAY NO. 16
PROJECT Gas Well AFE # 7031788
Site Supervisor Terry Blacquier 435-220-0701 Start Depth 6134.0
[Rig Manager Marshall Gallegos 505 486 6812 End Depth 6312.0
Contractor - Rig # Patterson 747 Daily Progress 178.0
License 43-037-
31879-0000 AVG ROP 19.78
Lease & road condition drying & good [Weather | showers Temp 60
From [To Time Code Detailed Description of Daily Operations
6:00 7:00 1.00 5 Circulate and condition mud
7:00 9:30 2.50 6 Wiper trip 19std's
9:30 10:00 0.50 5 Circulated trip gas
10:00 12:30 2.50 2 Drilled 7 7/8" hole{6134 to 6200’}
12:30 13:00 0.50 5 Circulated up 6200' sample
13:00 13:30 0.50 2 Drilled 7 7/8" hole{6200 to 6210’}
13:30 14:00 0.50 5 Circulated up 6210' sample
14:00 14:30 0.50 2 Drilled 7 7/8" hole{6210 to 6231'}
14:30 15:00 0.50 5 Circulated up 6230' sample
15:00 15:30 0.50 2 Drilled 7 7/8" hole{6231 to 6240’}
15:30 16:00 0.50 5 Circulated up 6240' sample
16:00 16:30 0.50 2 Drilled 7 7/8" hole{6240 to 6250'}
16:30 17:00 0.50 5 Circulated up 6250' sample
17:00 17:30 0.50 2 Drilled 7 7/8" hole{6250 to 6260}
17:30 18:00 0.50 5 Circulated up 6250° sample
18:00 18:30 0.50 7 Rig Serviced,crossover meeting
18:30 21:30 3.0 2 Drilled 7 7/8" hole{6260 to 6312},core point
21:30 1:30 4.0 5 Circulate and condition mud {weigt up 9.1ppg}
1:30 6:00 4.5 6 Hoist to core
24.00
|Pumps - #1 - 9P-100, #2 - FB-1300 - GPS @ 97% Strokes 120 | SOLIDS CONTROL EQUIPMENT
#1 - 6" Liner @ 3.4 #2 - 6" Liner @ 4.28 425 gpm __|IShaker Make - Derrick Swaco
Pump Pressure (Alr) 1330 psi Shaker Mesh 80 x80
Rotary/WOB 55 2200 ____|Desander |Desiter |Centifuge #1 |[Centifuge #2
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE (Water) 300 BBL Volume gpm
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE BBL O.F
FLUIDS IN TANKS 600 BBL U.F
|Mud weight / Viscosity 9.1 48 ~ hrs
, , ] , 24 Hour Look Ahead , ,
|Fuel on Hand 1700 gallons  JHoist to core.R.I.H with core barrel.Cut core.Hoist and recover
|Fuel Delivered Today gallons Jcore.
Isurveys Depth Inclination
|see above directional survey's
Last BOP Test 13/05/08
] ] _ Daily _Accum DAILY TOTAL $40,936
Rig Hours From Spud: 24 259 PREVIOUS TOTAL $784,001
_Rotating Hours _ 9 137.5 _CUMULATIVE TOTAL _ $824,938
SUPERVISOR: Terry Blacquier PROJECTED AFE TOTAL $989,973




DAILY DRILLING REPORT
Baytex Energy USA Ltd e T s C 11
ELL: Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 ' REPORT #: 17 | oae 23/05/08
Depth @06:00 ; 6326 mKB | ProGREss: 14 ft in 8 rotating hours (last 24 hours)
(Operations @06:00 : Cutting core #1 FOREMAN:  TJ Blacquier MOBILE NO.:  403-548-1227
[bay cosr: $37,527 HOLE CND.: good WEATHER: rain TOOLPUSH: M Gallegos
loum cosr: $862,465 RIG/RIG# Patterson 747 TEMP.: 61 T.P.MOBILE: 505-486-6812
[FormaTioN: Ismay K.B. ELEV.: 6130.00 ROADS: muddy Geologist Bob Gould
[[BIT PERFORMANCE SURVEYS DRILLING FLUID [[lPUMPS
2 3C  {depth{mkb} inc Azmuth [[Time 18:00 #1 #2
77/8 7 27/32 6312 Omega Omega
United Dowdco 94 L-750 L-750
UD513 C2299 0.49 6.5X8" 6.0X8"
3609 CP-43 50 64
2x14/5x18 23 4.48 0.00
3863 6312 18 95% 95%
6312 6326 17/37 565 psi
65 8 10.0 ft/sec
20 i8 7 ft/sec
50 50 1 ft/sec
2-2-ce-x-i-nd [MUD & CHEMICALS
core pt 69 min
2449 14 45 min
37.7 1.8 325 bb!'s
65 8 667 bbl's
BOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY TYPE 0D /1D(in) LENGTH [sugwix1o00| 130105 [isystem Vol. 992 bl
TYPE OD/ID(n) | LENGTH Avail WOB: 25000  |[[Mud & Chemicals Added:
Bty 77/8 JtsDP in hole: 168 Gel 118 BaraCarb 50
Bitsub| 61/4 0.20 m UtsDP on rcks: 83 Barite 269  Sawdust 5
Core Barre! 61/2 28.00 m DP on Loc: 251 Caustic 1
x/o 61/4 250m DP Conn: 4.5"XH |[EZ Mud 2
Jars 61/4 15.60 m DC Conn: 45"XH |IPaR 1
HWDP| 4172 920.73 BHA Length: 967.03 it [WELL CONTROL __|IMud Daily Cost $3,487
IDRILLING OPERATIONS TIME BREAKDOWN |loss circ [Mud cum Cost $18,829
Slip and cut DST RSPP-SPM I[SOLIDS CONTROL
Survey Fishing MACP(psi) 712 |lshaker Make Derrick
Logging Direct. Work  Hole Fill [lshaker Mesh 80 x80
8 Run Casing Handle Tools 3 ct Hole Fill Centrifuge |Centrifuge
Cementing R/M Hole tBOP Drill: | 22/05/08 [[Vol UF (gpm)
31/2 |woc Safety Mtg Daylights U.F. (ppg)
81/2 [NuBOPs raveyards O.F. (ppg)
Test BOPs Lst Sfty Mtg 22/05/08 |[Hours/Days
1 Drill Out Gt Total Hrs 24 etyTopic | general [[Boiler Hrs: 0 (to 24:00)
{24 HOUR SUMMARY report for: May 23/08-06:00 to May 24/08 - 06:00hrs
Hoisted to core.Serviced and laid down directional tools.Picked up and made up core barrel.Repaired rig{floor throttle}.Ran in
with core barrel,breaking circulation at 2200,4500' & 6200'.Circulated out trip gas.Washed to bottom{6250-6312'}.Drop core
ball.Cut core #1{6312-6326'}
[Note : Directional personal and tools released and off location
Operations @ 24/05/08-06:00 hrs -
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DAILY DRILLING REPORT
Baytex Energy USA Ltd
600 - 17th Street, Suite #1900 S Office: 435-825-2777
Denver, Colorado, 80202 Fax: 303-825-2790
WELL NAME Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 DATE 23-May-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID 43-037-31879-0000 DAY NO. 17
PROJECT Gas Well AFE # 7031788
Site Supervisor Terry Blacquier 435-220-0701 Start Depth 6312.0
Rig Manager Marshall Gallegos 505 486 6812 End Depth 6326.0
Contractor - Rig # Patterson 747 Daily Progress 14.0
License 43-037-31879
[Lice 0000 5 AVG ROP 1.75
|Lease & road condition wet & muddy |[Weather | Rain Temp 63
From |[To Time Code Detailed Description of Daily Operations
6:00 9:00 3.00 6 Hoist to core
9:00 11:00 2.00 20 Serviced & laid down directional tools
11:00 12:00 -1.00 22 Pick up & make up core barrel
12:00 13:00 1.00 8 Rig Repair {floor throttle}
13:00 18:30 5.50 6 Run in with Core Barrel{broke circ @ 1200°,2200',4500' & 6200'
18:30 19:00 0.50 5 Circulate out trip gas
19:00 21:30 2.50 5 Washed to bottom{6250 - 6312}
21:30 22:00 0.50 5 Drop core ball,Circulate
22:00 6:00 8.00 4 Cut Core #1{6312 to 6326'}
6:00
24.00 .
[Pumps - #1 - 9P-100, #2 - FB-1300 - GPS @ 97% Strokes 64 | _SOLIDS CONTROL EQUIPMENT
l#1-6" Liner @ 3.4 #2 - 6" Liner @ 4.28 210 gpm___[iShaker Make Derrick Swaco
[Pump Pressure (Air) 565 psi Shaker Mesh 80 x80
{Rotary'woOB 55 16000 Desander  |Desilter Centifuge #1 |Centituge #2
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE (Water) 120 BBL Volumne gpm
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE ] BBL O.F
JFLUIDS IN TANKS 600 BBL U.F
[Mud Weight / Viscosity 93 52 hrs
_ ] ... 24 Hour Look Ahead
Fuel on Hand 1350 galions Cut core #1.Hoist and recover core #1.
}Fuel Delivered Taday gallons
Isurveys Depth Inclination
{see directional survey report
_Last BOP Test 13/05/08
] o I ] _ | Daily | Accum DAILY TOTAL $37,527
Rig Hours From Spud: ) 23 | 282 PREVIOUS TOTAL $824,938
Rotating Hours 8 145.5 CUMULATIVE TOTAL $862,465
SUPERVISOR: Terry Blacquier PROJECTED AFE TOTAL $989,973




} y YR I TH'H B X
DAILY DRILLING REPORT | CONFIDENTIAL |
Baytex Energy USA Lid bt Dave Eriecor -
fiweLs: Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 REPORT# 18 DATE: 24/05/08
| Depth @06:00 : 6384 mKB | ProGREss: 58 ft in 5 rotating hours (last 24 hours)
ioperations @06:00 : Circulating up sample FOREMAN: _ TdJ Blacquier MOBILENO.:  403-548-1227
[lpaLy cosT: $57,411 |HoLE N good WEATHER:  cloudy TOOLPUSH: M Gallegos
fcum cosT: $919,875 |nG/riG#:  Patterson 747 TEMP.: 62 TP.MOBILE:  505-486-6812
FORMATION: Hovenswee| K.B. ELEV.: 6130.00 ROADS: dryin Geologist Bob Gould
|BIT PERFORMANCE | SURVEYS ||DRILLING FLUID "PUMPS
i 3C 4RR  |leptn{mkb} inc Azmuth  [fTime 13:00 |lPump No. #1 #2
7 27/32 77/8 6342 |[make Omega Omega
Dowdco | United 9.3 Model L-750 L-750
C2299 Ub513 0.48  |fLiner X stk 65X8" 6.0X8"
CP-43 3609 54 PM 65
2x14/5x18 23 Pump Rate 4.55 0.00
6312 6342 20 Pump Eff, 95% 95%
6342 6384 17/37  |lpump Press. 600 psi
131/2 2 9.0 Drillpipe AV 0 fi/sec
18 20 6.3 Drilicollar AV 0 ft/sec
50 50 1 Nozzle Vel 0 ft/sec
2-2-ce-x--nd 0.5 [IMUD & CHEMICALS
recovery | core pt 5.0 ud Cycle 7 min
30 42 Bariod ottoms Up 0 min
22 21.0 C Tippeits [[Tanks 34 bbl's
131/2 66 5001 ole Volume 0 bbl's
[BOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY TYPE OD/1D(in) LENGTH  Igyrq wix1000| 130 Ibs | tem Vol, 34 bbl's
TYPE OD/ID(in) | LENGTH Avail WOB: 25  |Mud & Chemicals Added:
Bitf 77/8 1.00 JtsDP in hole: 169 Cederfiber 1
Motor| 61/2 27.58 JtsDP on rks: 82 Baracarb 306
HWDP 41/2 308.08 DP on Loc: 251 Desco 2
Jars| 6 1/4 30.40 DP Conn: 4.5"XH
HWDP 41/2 611.15 DC Conn: 4.5"XH
BHA Length: 978.21 ft [WELL CONTROL __|[Mud Daily Cost $5,338
IIDRILLING OPERATIONS TIME BREAKDOWN {iLoss circ [Imud Cum Cost $24,167
RU&TO Isip and cut DST RSPP-SPM [[SOLIDS CONTROL
Drill Actual 2 Survey Fishing MACP(psi) 712 |lshaker Make Derrick
Reaming Logging Direct. Work Calc Hole Fill [lsnaxer Mesh 80 x80
ring 51/2 |RuncCasing Handles Tools 1 Hole Fill Centrifuge [Centrifuge
Rm Rathole 1 Cementing R/M Hole Lst BOP Dril: | 23/05/08 |[[Vol UF (gpm)
ond / Circ 1 WOC |Safety Mig Daylights U.F. (ppg)
ripping 11 1/2 |NuBOPs Recover Core 2 Graveyards .F. (ppg)
ubricate Rig Test BOPs Lst Sfty Mig 24/05/08 |[Hours/Days
Repair Rig Drill Out Crat Total Hrs 24 foty Topic general I_Boiler Hrs: 0 (to 24:00)
[24 HOUR SUMMARY report for: May 24/08-06:00 to May 25/08 - 06:00hrs

Operations @ 25/05/08-06:00 hrs - Circulating up sample/bottoms up at 6384'{core point #2

Cut core #1{6326-6342"}.Circulated up sample.Hoisted core #1.Recovered core #1{ 30' full recovery}.Picked up and made up motor
PDC and jars.Ran in with bit #4RR,breaking circulation at 2200,5000 and 6300.Washed to bottom and reamed rathole{6289 - 63421%.
Drilled 7 7/8" hole {6342 - 6384'},core point #2.Circulate up sample.




DAILY DBRILILING REPORT

Baytex Energy USA Ltd
600 - 17th Street, Suite #1900 S Office: 435-825-2777
Denver, Colorado, 80202 Fax: 303-825-2790
WELL NAME Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 DATE 24-May-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID 43-037-31879-0000 DAY NO. 18
PROJECT Gas Well AFE # 7031788
Site Supervisor Terry Blacquier 435-220-0701 Start Depth 6326.0
I_lﬂg Manager Marshall Gallegos 505 486 6812 End Depth 6384.0
Contractor - Rig # Patterson 747 Daily Progress 58.0
ILlcense 43-037-
31879-0000 AVG ROP 7.73
Lease & road condition wet & muddy |WeatL\er | showers Temp 62
From |To Time Code Detailed Description of Daily Operations
6:00 11:30 5.50 4 Cut Core #1{6326 t06342'}
11:30 12:30 1.00 5 Circulated up sample
12:30 19:30 7.00 6 Hoisted Core #1
19:30 21:30 2.00 22 Recover Core #1 { full recovery 30'}
21:30 22:30 1.00 23 Pick up & Made up motor/PDC/Jars
22:30 3:00 4.50 6 Run in with bit #4RR
3:00 4:00 1.00 3 Washed to bottom,reamed rathole{6289 to 6342'}
4:00 6:00 2.00 2 Drilled 7 7/8" hole{6342 to 6384'}, core pt #2
6:00
24.00
[Pumps - #1 - 9P-100, #2 - FB-1300 - GPS @ 97% Strokes 65 | ] SOLIDS CONT'ﬁOL EQUIPMENT
J#1 - 6" Liner @ 3.4 #2 - 6" Liner @ 4.28 320 gom  [|Shaker Make| Detrick Swaco
IPump Pressure (Air) 600 psi Shaker Mesh 80 x80
IRotaryywoOB 55 2200 ~ |Desander |Desiter  |Centifuge #1 |Centifuge #2
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE (Water) BBL  |volume gpm
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE BBL O.F
JFLUIDS IN TANKS 600 BBL U.F
IMud Weight / Viscosity 9.3 54 hrs
— - 1 24 Hour Look Ahead _
|Fue! on Hand 2750 gallons Iﬁoist to core.R.I.H_with core barrel.Cut core #2.Hoist and recover
IFuel Delivered Today 2000 gallons Jcore.
ISurveys - Depth Inclination
ISee directional survey report
LastBOPTest _13/05/08 ) —
Daily Accum DAILY TOTAL $57,411
_ Rig Hours From Spud: 24 306 PREVIOUS TOTAL $862,465
Rotating Hours _ 7.5 153.0 CUMULATIVE TOTAL $919,875
_ SUPERVISOR: _ Terry Blacquier PROJECTED AFETOTAL |  $989,973




BAYTEX

ENERGY USA LTD

June 2, 2008

Division of Qil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Attn: Carol Daniels

RE: Baytex Energy USA Ltd
May 2008 — Week 5 Drilling Reports
Devil Mesa Unit #1-13 Well
API Well No. 43-037-31879
Section 13, T36S — R23E, SENW
San Juan County, Utah

Dear Ms. Daniels,

Please find copies of the Baytex Energy USA Ltd Drilling Reports for the dates listed
below:

May 2008 - Week S

Sunday 5/25/2008
Monday 5/26/2008
Tuesday 5/27/2008
Wednesday 5/28/2008
Thursday 5/29/2008
Friday 5/30/2008

If you have any questions or concerns please don’t hesitate to call me at: 303 825-2777.

Sigeerely,

G D
COW AN
g A

Lokelani F. Narte!

Enclosures
In/s
RECEIVED
JUN 05 2008
DIV, GF Clb., GAS & i g
Z:\Memos\C\Carol Daniels\Jun 02.doc 600 Seventeenth Street | Telephone 303.825.2777

Suite 1900 South Facsimile 303.825.2790
Denver, CO 80202 www.baytex.ab.ca



UNHBENTW DAILY DRILLING REPORT

- Y »h N4 \
3205 | CONFIDENTIAL
Baytex Energy USA Ltd AA-02V BN T 12e i
[weLL: Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 REPORT# 24 | DaTE:  30/05/08
" Depth @06:00 : 6590 mKB J PROGRESS: 0 ft in rotating hours (last 24 hours)
{loperations @06:00 : Waiting on completions FOREMAN:  TJ Blacquier MOBILE NO.:  403-548-1227
[lbay cosT: $22,798 HOLE CND.: WEATHER: _ Clear TOOLPUSH: M Gallegos
[lcum cosr: $1,279,638 RIG/RIG# Patterson 747 TEMP.: 71 T.P.MOBILE: _505-486-6812
[lFormATION: Akah K.B. ELEV.: 6133.00 ROADS: good Geologist Bob Gould
{[BIT PERFORMANCE SURVEYS DRILLING FLUID  [[PUMPS
Bit No. ldepthimkb) inc Azmuth  [[Time Pump No. #1 #2
Size (in) Depth(ft) Make Omega Omega
Mig. Density /ppg Model L-750 L-750
ype Mud Grad 0.00  Jjuiner X stk 6.5X8" 6.0Xx8"
Serial # Vis sec/qrt PM
Nozzles PV Pump Rate 0.00 0.00
From (mKB) P 1b/100ft2 Pump Eff. 95% 95%
o0 (MKB) Gels Pump Press. psi
Hrs on Bit pH Drillpipe AV 0 ft/sec
WOB (k/Ibs) WL (cc's) Drillcollar AV 0 ft/sec
RPM Filter Cake Nozzle Vel 0 ft/sec
Condition Sand (%) {MUD & CHEMICALS
Pulled For? Solids (%) Mud Cycle 0 min
Feet Mud Co. Bariod  [[Bottoms Up 0 min
t/hr Mud Man C Tippetts |[Tanks bbl's
Cum Hrs Mud Up @ 5001 JiHole Volume 0 bbl's
IBOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY TYPE OD/ ID(in) LENGTH Strg Wt x 1000 IISystem Vol. 0 bbl's
TYPE OD/ID(n) | LENGTH Avail WOB: [[Mud & Chemicals Added:
JtsDP in hole:
JtsDP on rcks: 251
DP on Loc: 251
DP Conn: 4.5"XH
DC Conn: 4.5"XH
BHA Length: 0.004t [[WELL CONTROL |iMud Daily Cost $0
[DRILLING OPERATIONS TIME BREAKDOWN LOSS CIRC liMud Cum Cost $0
RU & TO 4 Slip and cut pST RSPP-SPM {ISOLIDS CONTROL
Drill Actual Survey Fishing MACP(psi) [lsnaker Make Derrick
Reaming Logging Direct. Work alc Hole Fill “Shaker Mesh 140 x 80
Coring Run Casing Move Rig ct Hole Fill Centrifuge |Centrifuge
Rm Rathole Cementing R/M Hole Lst BOP Drill: | 23/05/08 [{Vol UF (gpm)
Cond / Circ wWOoC Safety Mig Daylights U.F. (ppg)
[Tripping NU BOP's raveyards .F. {ppg)
Lubricate Rig Test BOPs Lst Sfty Mig 30/05/08 ||Hours/Days
Repair Rig Drill Out Cmit Total Hrs 4 afety Topic rig move "_BO"GF Hrs 0 (to 24:00)
24 HOUR SUMMARY repott for: May 30/08-06:00 to May 31/08 - 06:00hrs
Tore out rig.Demob rental equipment.Prepare for Rig move.
RIG RELEASED 30/05/08 @ 10:00hrs
Note : Rig moved today all Paterson equipment off location at 30/05/08 @ 16:00hrs
: Returned rentals to venders 31/05/08
Operations @ 31/05/08-06:00 hrs - Waiting on completions
RECEIVED

JUN 05 2008
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
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Baytex Energy USA Ltd

600 - 17th Street, Suite #1900 S

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Office: 435-825-2777

CONFIDENTIAL

Denver, Colorado, 80202 Fax: 303-825-2790
WELL NAME .- ... ... |Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 .- - o s DATE: -1 30-May-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID . 143-037-31879-0000 " 3 ' - DAYNO. - |~ 24 =
lProsECT e Wl — T P FEF T Josires
|site Supervisor =~ |Terry Blacquier - . |435-220-0701. . ‘Start Depth 0.0
Iﬂl_g Manager - |JeffPeters| " '|970-371-3162 - End Depth 0.0
Contractor-Rlg # - |Patterson 747 : g Dally Progress 0.0
: 43-037- v . ,
ILicense. 21879-0000 , K .AVG ROP ,
|Lease & road.condition ’ |Weather | . clear Temp 53
From |To . Time Code Detailed Description of Daily Operations
6:00 10:00 4.00 1 Tear Out Rig & Demob Rental
10:00
0:00 RIG RELEASED 30/05/08 @ 10:00rs
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
4.00
[Pumps - #1.- 9P-100, #2 - FB-1300 - GPS'@ 97% Strokes " SOLIDS CONTROL EQUIPMENT
|#1- 6" Liner @ 3.4 #2 - 6" Liner @ 4.28 856 Swaco Swaco
Pump Pressure (Air)
Rotary/WOB - . |Desander  |Desilter - " [Centifuge #1' |Centifuge #2 . -
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE (Water) Volumé gpm-
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE O.F
FLUIDS IN TANKS CUE
Mud Weight / Viscosity hrs
I I 1 - 24 Hour Look Ahead
|Fuel on Hand g ons.~ JDrilled 8.5" hole ahead and survey as required.
|Fuel Delivered Today e
Surveys
See directional survey report
“LastBOPTest - | R
o B -} Accum- J.. - - DALY TOTAL- ... $22798 . . .|
_Rig Hours From Spud: - = - v | 1009 | PREVIOUSTOTAL - . | .  $1,256840 =
-~ Rotating-Hours-— I Pt - 1 1010 . CUMULATIVE TOTAL. .$1,279.,638 -
o GUPERVISOR: el Terry Blacguler :"'L-‘ " PROJECTED AFETOTAL | -~ ~ $989,973 ]




Baytex Energy USA Ltd

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

CONFIDENTIAL

Report For : Dave Friesen

werL: Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 REPORT# 23 | pate:  29/05/08
Depth @06:00 : 6590 mKB [ PROGRESS: 0ft in rotating hours (last 24 hours)
Operations @06:00 : Tearing out rig FoRemAN:  TJ Blacquier MOBILE NO.:  403-548-1227
baLy cosT: $171,642 HOLE OND.: cased WEATHER: clear TOOLPUSH: M Gallegos
floum cosr: $1,256,840 RIG/RIG# _Patterson 747 TEMP.: 74 TP.MOBILE:  505-486-6812
[IFormATION: Akah KB.ELEV.  6133.00 ROADS: good Geologist Bob Gould
(BIT PERFORMANCE SURVEYS DRILLING FLUID [[PUMPS
Bit No. depth{mkb} inc Azmuth  |[Time 16:00  [|Pump No. #1 #2
Size (in) Depth(ft) 6590 Make Omega Omega
Mfg. Density /ppg 9 Model L-750 L-750
Type Mud Grad Liner X Stk 6.5 X 8" 6.0 X 8"
Serial # Vis sec/art 43 SPM 70
Nozzles PV Pump Rate 4.90 0.00
From (mKB) YP Ib/100ft2 Pump Ef. 95% 95%
To (MKB) Gels Pump Press. 600 psi
Hrs on Bit pH 9.0 Drillipe AV ft/sec
WOB (k/lbs) WL (cc's) Drilicollar AV ft/sec
RPM Filter Cake [Nozzle Vel fi/sec
(Condition Sand (%) IMUD & CHEMICALS
Pulled For? Solids (%) Mud Cycle 46 min
Feet Mud Co. Bariod  |[Bottomis Up 38 min
hr Mud Man C Tippetts [[Tanks 200 bbl's
ICum Hrs Mud Up @ 5001 Hole Volume 330 bbl's
BOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY TYPE OD /1D(in) LENGTH g1 wt x 1000 flsystem vol. 530 bbl's
TYPE OD/ID(n) | LENGTH Avail WOB IMud & Chemicals Added:
JisDP in hole: Inventory Check
JtsDP on reks: 251 Baracarb 12 Soda Ash 1
DP on Loc: 251 Pac R 1 Barite 22
DP Conn: 45"XH |[Cedar Fiber  Desco 5
DC Conn: 4.5"XH [|Gel 8
BHALengt: | 000t |WELL CONTROL __|[Mud Daily Cost $1,396
[DRILLING OPERATIONS TIME BREAKDOWN joss cire Mud Cum Cost $28,126
RU & TO Slip and cut DST RSPP-SPM SOLIDS CONTROL
Drill Actual Survey Fishing MACP(psi) 712 Shaker Make Derrick
Reaming Logging Direct. Work Calc Hole Fill Shaker Mesh 140 x 80
Coring Run Casing 6 1/2  |move Rig ct Hole Fill Centrifuge |Centrifuge
Rm Rathole Cementing 11/2 |Clean Tanks 4 Lst BOP Drill: | 23/05/08 [[Vol UF (gpm)
Cond / Circ 21/2 |woc Safety Mtg 1/2 Daylights U.F. (opg)
ripping NU BOP's ‘WO Drift 5 Graveyards IO.F. (ppg)
| ubricate Rig Test BOPs Slips/Wellhead 4 Lst Sfty Mtg 29/05/08 |[Hours/Days
Repair Rig Drill Out Cmt Total Hrs 24 Safety Topic | cementing ||Boiler Hrs 0 {to 24:00)
24 HOUR SUMMARY report for: May 29/08-06:00 to May 30/08 - 06:00hrs

Waited on 4.5" drift for casing.Rigged to and ran casing,Ran 6595.55' of 4.5" x 11.6lb/ft J55 LT&C casing.Landed at 6590.00'
Circulated casing.Rigged in Halliburton,held safety/JSA meeting.Cemented casing with 620sks{310bbls},Standard cement
11.5lb/gal with 3% Econolite+.25% Polyflake+10Ib/sk Gilsonite,tailed in 292sks{80bbls} POZ 50/50 12.5Ib/gal with .2%
Halad-R+.125LB/SK Polyflke+.3%D-AlIR+.2%CFR-3.Plug down at 29/05/08-21:58hrs,60bbls good returns.Tore out Bop's,set

slips and cut casing.Dress casing,installed Careron wellhaed,with Cameron personal.Cleaned tanks tore out rig.

Operations @ 30/05/08-06:00 hrs - Tearing out rig

Note : Plug down at 29/05/08@21:58 hrs,60bbls good returns, fill rat/mouse holes with cement
: Lost 6hrs due to waiting on drift for casing
: Filled rat & mouse holes with cement

RECEIVED

JUN 05 2008
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING



ot DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Baytex Energy USA Lid

600 - 17th Street, Suite #1900 S Office: 435-825-2777
Denver, Colorado, 80202 Fax: 303-825-2790
WELLNAME . - |DevilMesaUnit1-13 -~ = j - DATE - 29-May-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID - 43-037-31879-0000 . = ” : L DAY NO.- - 23
PROJECT -~ lGasWell e v v AFE # 1. 7031788
|Site Supervisor - |Terry Blacquier Lo 435-220-0701 - Start Depth 0
[Rig Manager : Jeff Peters 970-371-3162 End Depth 0.0
Contractor - Rig # Patterson 747 . . . v Daily Progress 0.0
JLicense 43-037- O .
31879-0000 e AVG ROP #DIV/0!
Lease & road condition __|dry&good - . [Weather Jclear | — Temp = - 7
From |To Time Code Detailed Description of Daily Operations
6:00 11:00 5.00 23 Wait on 4.5" drift & Snake
11:00 17:30 6.50 12 Run 4 1/2 x 11.6 Ib/ft Casing
17:30 20:00 2.50 5 Circulated Csing & condition mud
20:00 20:30 0.50 22 Rigged in Halliburton,held JSA Safety meeting
20:30 22:00 1.50 12 Cemented Casing
22:00 0:00 2.00 14 Tear out BOP's,set slips,cut casing
0:00 2:00 2.00 14 Install wellhead with Cameron
2:00 6:00 4.00 1 Clean tanks
6:00
0:00 Plug down at 29/05/08@21:58hrs,60bbls good returns
24.00
Pumps - #1 - 9P-100, #2 - FB-1300 - GPS @ 97% Strokes 0 : SOLIDS CONTROL EQUIPMENT -
#1 - 6" Liner @ 3.4 #2 - 6" Liner @ 4.28 356 gpm Shaker Make Swaco Swaco
Pump Pressure (Air) 1189 -1 . psi - HShaker Mesh
Rotary/WOB 55 24000 ] Desander = |Desilter Centifuge #1 |[Centifuge #2
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE (Water) - ] esL Jvolume gpm
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE ] ; ... BBL i O.F
FLUIDS IN TANKS 400 BBL ] UF
Mud Weight / Viscosity g b4 0 hrs
: : ) ) . ’ 24 Hour Look Ahead
Fuel on Hand . 750 | gallons {Tear out ,demab rental equipment.Release and move rig.
Fuel Delivered Today L 1. -gallons
Surveys " ' B | ~Depth ]inclination
See directional survey report _
_Last BOP Test | 13058 }
o . : Daily “Accum [ DAILY TOTAL ' : $171,642
~ - Rig Hours From Spud: T~ 24 1 T4260 1 "_PREVIOUSTOTAL* R I ,085,199 =
.. - RotatingHouwrs... -~ | oo ). CUMULATIVETOTAL | $1.256.840
- SUPERVISOR: Terry Blacquler PROJECTED AFE TOTAL - $989,973




s

DAILY DRILLING REPOR C(,NF]I)F

INTIAL

Baytex Energy USA Ltd
IV_VELL: Devil Mesa Unit 1-13

REPORT #: 22 J DATE:  28/05/08
f Depth @06:00 : 6590 mKB | PROGRESS: 0ft in rotating hours (last 24 hours)
[loperations @06:00 : Waiting on 4.5" casing drift & snake FOREMAN:  TJ Blacquier MOBILE NO.:  403-548-1227
[lbary cosT: $48,220 HOLE CND.: good WEATHER: _ Clear TOOLPUSH: _Jeff Peters
[lcum cos: $1,084,399 RIG/RIG#: _Patterson 747 TEMP.: 71 TP.MOBILE: 505-486-6812
FORMATION: Akah K.B. ELEV.: 6133.00 ROADS: good Geologist Bob Gould
BIT PERFORMANCE SURVEYS DRILLING FLUID  {[PUMPS
Bit No. 5 depth{mkb} inc Azmuth |[Time 11:00  [{Pump No. #1 #2
Size (in) 77/8 Depth(it) 6580 |Make Omega Omega
Mfg. United Density /ppg 9.1 Model L-750 L-750
ype uUD513 Mud Grad 0.47 |luirerxsk | 6.5X8" 6.0 X 8"
Serial # 3584 Vis sec/grt 65 SPM 75
Nozzles 2x14/5x18 PV 2 Pump Rate 5.25 0.00
From (mKB) 6412 YP Ib/100ft2 15 Pump Eff. 95% 95%
0 (mKB) 6580 Gels 12/25 |PumpPress./] 560  psi
Hrs on Bit pH 9.5 Drillpipe AV ft/sec
WOB (k/Ibs) WL (cc's) 6 Drillcollar AV ft/sec
RPM Filter Cake 1 Nozzle Vel ft/sec
Condition Sand (%) 0.5 [[MUD & CHEMICALS
Pulled For? Solids (%) 4.200 |Imud cycle 87 min
Feet 0 Mud Co. Bariod |[Bottoms Up 34 min
t/hr Mud Man C Tippetts [franks 310 bbis
Cum Hrs Mud Up @ 5001 Hole Volume 330 bbl's
[[BOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY TYPE OD/1D{in) LENGTH foirg wex 1000, 133108 Jlsystem vol. 640  bbl's
TYPE OD/1D(in) | LENGTH Avail WOB: 25  |Mud & Chemicals Added:
Bit 7718 1.00 JtsDP in hole: 178 Barazan 1
Bit Sub 61/2 27.58 JtsDP on rcks: 73 EZ Mud 1
HWDP 41/2 308.08 DP on Loc: 251 Sawdust 5
Jars| 6 1/4 30.40 DP Conn: 4.5"XH
HWDP 41/2 611.15 DC Conn: 4.5"XH
BHA Length: 978.21 f ITWELL CONTROL  {[Mud Daily Cost $630
IDRILLING OPERATIONS TIME BREAKDOWN fi,oss circ lIMud Cum Cost $27,828
RU & TO Slip and cut 1 DST RSPP-SPM SOLIDS CONTROL
Drill Actual Survey Fishing MACP (psi) 712 [[shaker Make Derrick
Reaming Logging 11/2 Direct. Work Calc Hole Fill "Shaker Mesh 80 x80
oring Run Casing WO Drift 1/2 ct Hole Fill } Centrifuge |Centrifuge
Rm Rathole Cementing R/M Hole Lst BOP Drill: | 23/05/08 |[Vol UF (gpm)
[Cond / Circ 41/2 |woc Safety Mtg 1/2 Daylights U.F. (ppg)
ripping 12 NU BOP's Unlaod Csg 2 Graveyards .F. (ppg)
Lubricate Rig 1/2 Test BOPs R/U Csg Crew 11/2  |lst Sfty Mtg 27/05/08 |[Hours/Days
Repair Rig Drifl Out Cmt Total Hrs 24 afety Topic fripping ][Boiler Hre 0 (to 24:00)
{24 HOUR SUMMARY report for: May 28/08-06:00 to May 29/08 - 06:00hrs

Finished logging with Weatherford.Slip and cut line.Ran in with bit{filled pipe at 2500,5000,6400'.Broke circulation washed
100' to bottom.Circulate and conditioned.Unloaded and strap casing.Laid down pipe.Picked up kelly & broke down quill.
Laid down HWDP.Rigged out lay down lines,rigged in casing crew/tongs.Held JSA safety meeting.Waited on 4.5" casing

drift and snake.

Note : Muddloger Bob Gould now off location,gas detector demobed

Operations @ 29/05/08-06:00 hrs - Waiting on arrival of 4.5" casing drift and snake

RECEIED |

JUN 05 2008
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
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Baytex Energy USA Ltd

600 - 17th Street, Suite #1900 S
Denver, Colorado, 80202

Office: 435-825-2777
Fax: 303-825-2790

WELL NAME ' - - |Devii:MesaUnit 1-13 . DATE 28-May-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID - +|43-037-31879-0000 DAY NO. = 22
|prROJECT |Gas Well. o AFE#. 7031788
Site- Supervisor - - |Terry Blacquier 435:220-0701 - . Start Depth 6590
Rig Manager _|Jett Peters | 970-371-3162 End Depth 6590
|Contractor-Rig# _[Patterson 747 i _Daily Progress 0.0
License az037- | - ’
31879-0000 | L Lo AVG ROP 0.00
[Lease & roadcondition |dry & good Weather clear Temp 72
From |To Time Code Detailed Description of Daily Operations
6:00 7:30 1.50 11 Log with Weatherford
7:30 8:30 1.00 9 Slip and Cut drilling line
8:30 14:30 6.00 6 Run in with bit{fill pipe at 2500,5000,6400'}
14:30 15:00 0.50 5 Break Circulation ,wash 100" to bottom
15:00 18:00 3.00 5 Circulate & Condition
18:00 18:30 0.50 7 Rig Service, held crossover meeting
18:30 19:30 1.00 5 Circulate & Condition
19:30 21:30 2.00 21 Unload , Strap & Dress casing
21:30 1:30 4.00 6 Laid Down Pipe
1:30 2:00 0.50 22 Break Quill on Kelly
2:00 3:30 1.50 6 Laid Down HWDP
3:30 5:00 1.50 12 Rig out Lay down lines,Rigged in Casing crew
5:00 5:30 0.50 22 Held Safety Meeting, JSA meeting
5:30 6:00 0.50 23 Wait on 4.5" drift & Snake
6:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
24.00
Pumps - #1 - 9P-100, #2 - FB-1300 - GPS @ 97% Strokes 70 A SOLIDS CONTROL EQUIPMENT
#1 - 6" Liner @ 3.4 #2 - 6" Liner @ 4.28 281 . | gom ' [Shaker Make Swaco Swaco
Pump Pressure (Air) 560 - ) . psi » l’ 7haker Mesh
Rotary/WOB 55 | 24000 : " [Desander Desﬂter Centifuge #1|Centifuge #2
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE (Water) o gL fVolume gpm.
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE oo BBL g O.F
FLUIDS IN TANKS o600 1 BBL -~ UF
Mud Weight / Viscosity eq. s es. i hrs
\ e 24 Hour Look Ahead
Fuel on Hand 900 - |" “gaflons*]Run casing.Cement casin.Tear our prepare rig for move.
Fuel Delivered Today ’ gallens . *
Surveys __Depth | inclination]
See directional survey report
“meopTet | wems [ |
; R ek T T TPaly | CAceum |7 DAILYTOTAL [ "$48,2200 7
- Rig Hours From Spud: . - - 24 o) - 10,096 f - - PREVIOUS TOTAL - $1,036,179 - - -
T RotatingHours | "8 | 1010 | ~ CUMULATIVETOTAL ~ | = 1,084,399
... SUPERVISOR:. . . { ... Terry Blacquier.. ... |...PROJECTED AFETOTAL. | . ... ..$989.973 ... _ |
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DAILY DRILLING REPORT (:()Nl‘ II)ISN l lI‘L
Baytex Energy USA Ltd . e ee—
[weLL: Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 REPORT# 21 | DATE 27/05/08
" Depth @06:00 : 6590 mKB ’ PROGRESS: 178 ft in 4 1/2  rotating hours (last 24 hours)
[loperations @06:00:  Logging with Weatherford FOREMAN: TJ Blacquier  |MOBILENO..  403-548-1227
[loaiy cosr: $40,003 HOLE OND.: good WEATHER: clear TOOLPUSH: M Gallegos
[lcum cosT: $1,015,129 RIG/RIG# Patterson 747 TEMP.: 70 TP.MOBILE:  505-486-6812
[FormATION: Akah KB.ELEV.  6130.00 ROADS: good Geologist Bob Gould
[BIT PERFORMANCE SURVEYS [[DRILLING FLUID  [[PUMPS
Bit No. 5 depth{mkb} inc Azmuth  [fTime 11:00 [[Pump No. #1 #2
Size (in) 77/8 Depth(ft) 6580 Make Omega Omega
Mg United Density /ppg 9 Model L-750 L-750
ype UD513 Mud Grad 0.47  ||Liner X Stk 6.5X8" 6.0 X 8"
Serial # 3584 Vis sec/qrt 65.00 |[|lsPm 110
Nozzles 2x14/5x18 PV 2 Pump Rate 7.70 0.00
From (mKB) 6412 YP Ib/100ft2 15 Pump Eff. 95% 95%
o (MKB) 6580 Gels 12/25 |fPump Press. 1,400  psi
Hrs on Bit 41/2 pH 9.5 Drillpipe AV 196 fi/sec
OB (k/Ibs) 18 L (cc's) 6 Drilicollar AV ft/sec
RPM 60/motor Filter Cake 1 Nozzle Vel 196 ft/sec
Condition  |[1-1-I-X-ND Sand (%) 0.5 [IMUD & CHEMICALS
Pulled For? TD Solids (%) 4.200 {iMud cycle 87 min
Feet 168 0 Mud Co. Bariod  |[Bottoms Up 34 min
t/hr 37.3 Mud Man C Tippetts anks 310 bbl's
Cum Hrs 41/2 Mud Up @ 5001 |Hole Volume 330 bbl's
BOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY TYPE T OD/W(n | LENGTH [sugwix too0] 133 DS |lsystem Vol 640 bbls
TYPE | OD/ID(n) | LENGTH Avail WOB: 25  [Mud & Chemicals Added:
Bit 77/8 1.00 JtsDP in hole: 178 Baracarb 13 Caustic 1
Motor 61/2 27.58 JisDP on rcks: 73 Desco 4 Cedar Fiber 2
HWDP 41/2 308.08 DP on Loc: 251 PacR 1 Sawdust 5
Jars| 6 1/4 30.40 DP Conn: 45"XH ||EZ Mud 1
HWDP 41/2 611.15 DC Conn: 4.5"XH
BHA Length: | 978.21 ft JJWELL CONTROL  |{Mud Daily Cost $663
IDRILLING OPERATIONS TIME BREAKDOWN ~ Jioss circ [IMud cum cost $26,100
RU & TO Slip and cut DST RSPP-SPM SOLIDS CONTROL
Drill Actual 41/2 Survey Fishing MACP(psi) 712 Shaker Make Derrick
Reaming 1 Logging 9 Direct. Work Calc Hole Fill "Shaker Mesh 80 x80
Coring Run Casing Move Rig ct Hole Fill Centrifuge |Centrifuge
Rm Rathole Cementing R/M Hole Lst BOP Drill: | 23/05/08 |Vol UF (gpm)
(Cond / Circ 11/2 |woc Safety Mtg 1/2 Daylights U.F. (ppg) 15.1 15.1
ripping 7 NU BOP's Graveyards .F. (ppg) 9 9
Lubricate Rig 1/2 Test BOPs Lst Sfty Mtg 27/05/08 [[Hours/Days 2 2
Repair Rig Drill Out Cmt Total Hrs 24 afety Topic logging “BO”GI’ Hrs: 0 (to 24:00)
24 HOUR SUMMARY report for: May 27/08-06:00 to May 28/08 - 06:00hrs

Note: TD 6590' at 27/05/08@ 13:30hrs
: Logger TD 6588.00',Logs to bottom 27/05/08@ 21:58hrs

|Operations @ 38/05/08-06:00 hrs - Logging with Weatherford

Ran in with Bit #5{UD513}filled pipe at 2800 & 5800.Washed 30’ to bottom.Reamed rathole{6387-6414".Drilled 7 7/8" hole
{6414 to 6590} TD.Circulate and conditioned.Hoisted to log.Held safety meeting with Weatherford and rig personal.Rigged to
and logged with Weatherford Services.

| 'Y el W el LW 3 ol v
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DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING




_DAILY DRILLING REPORT

1 4
Baytex Energy USA Ltd
. N 4\l :
600 - 17th Street, Suite #1900 S ‘:"qu‘l])]& N l l 1‘] 4 Office: 435-825-2777
Denver, Colorado, 80202 Fax: 303-825-2790
WELL NAME ~ |Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 - R DATE 27-May-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID - - 143-037-31879-0000 ! R DAY NO. 21
[PROJECT -|Gas Well : : AFE # 7031788
[site Supervisor - |Terry Blacquier 435-220-0701-. Start Depth 6412
Rig Manager _|Marshall Gallegos _ {505 486 6812 End Depth 6590.0
Contractor- Rig# _|Patterson 747 Daily Progress 178.0
JLicense 43-037-
31879-0000 AVG ROP 39.56
Lease & road condition dry & good [Weather | clear Temp 70
From |To Time Code Detailed Description of Daily Operations
6:00 8:00 2.00 6 Ran in with bit {fill pipe at 2800',5800'}
8:00 9:00 1.00 3 Wash 30’ bottom,Ream rat hole{ 6387 to 6414'}
9:00 13:30 4.50 2 Drilled 7 7/8" hole{6414 to 6590'}, TD
13:30 15:00 1.50 5 Circulate and Condition
15:00 18:00 3.00 6 Hoist to log{conducted flow checks}
18:00 18:30 0.50 7 Rig Service.held crossover meetinhg
18:30 20:30 2.00 6 Hoist to log{conducted flow checks}
20:30 21:00 0.50 21 Held Safety Meeting with Weatherford & Rig Personal
21:00 6:00 9.00 11 Rigged to & Log with Weatherford Wireline
6:00
Logs to bottom at 27/05/08 @ 22:58hrs
Loggers TD 6588.00
24.00
Pumps - #1 - 9P-100, #2 - FB-1300 - GPS @ 97% Strokes 110 SOLIDS CONTROL EQUIPMENT
l#1 - 6" Liner @ 3.4 #2 - 6" Liner @ 4.28 856 | agpm  [lShaker Make| Derrick Swaco
|Pump Pressure 1400 . psi Shaker Mesh 80 x80
Rotary/WOB 55 {18000 o Desander [Desilter - |Centifuge #1 [Centifuge #2
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE (Water) ) "BBL  [Volume gpm
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE . BBL O.F 15.1 15.1
FLUIDS IN TANKS 600 BBL UF 9 g
Mud Weight / Viscosity 9.4~ 65 hrs 2 2
B 24 Hour Look Ahead
JFuel on Hand galions _JRun in Circulate & condition.Lay down pipe.Prepare to to run 4
|Fuel Detivered Today galions _]1/2" casing
Isurveys Int:linationl
See directional survey report
- Last BOP Test - 18/05/08 | -
T | "paily | Accum T T DAILYTOTAL $40,003 ]
Rig Hours From Spud: o DR 378 . PREVIOUS TOTAL - - - -$975,126 -
_Rotating Hours 4.5 171.5 CUMULATIVETOTAL |  $1,015,129
- ..SUPERVISOR: . . Terry.Blacquier ... | ... PROJECTED AFETOTAL. . ] . .. _$989,973 . ... .
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+ Baytex Energy USA Ltd

DAILY DRILLING REPORT C‘)NFII)E
R .

NTIAL

flweLL: Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 REPORT# 20 | DATE:  26/05/08
I Depth @06:00 : 6412 mKB | PROGRESS: 25 ft in 13 rotating hours (last 24 hours)
loperations @06:00 : Running in with bit FOREMAN: TJ Blacquier  |MOBILENO.:  403-548-1227
bbaiLy cosT: $28,223 HOLE CND.: good WEATHER: clear TOOLPUSH: M Gallegos
[lcum cosT: $975,126 RIG/RIG# Patterson 747 TEMP.: 71 T.P.MOBILE: _505-486-6812
[[FormaTION: Gothic KB.ELEV.  6130.00 ROADS: good Geologist Bob Gould
{[BIT PERFORMANCE SURVEYS DRILLING FLUID  [|PUMPS
Bit No. 3C 5 depth{mkb} inc Azmuth  [[Time 11:00 [[Pump No. #1 #2
Size (in) 7 27/32 77/8 Depth(ft) 6397 [vake Omega Omega
Mfg. Dowdco United Density /ppg 9.1 Model L-750 L-750
ype C2299 UD513 Mud Grad 0.47  ||Liner X Stk 6.5X8" 6.0 X 8"
Serial # CP-43 3773 Vis sec/qrt 57 SPM 66
Nozzles 2x14/5x18 PV 21 Pump Rate 4.62 0.00
From (mKB) 6384 6412 P lb/100fi2 17 Pump Eff. 95% 95%
o (MKB) 6412 Gels 11/20  |[Pump Press. 554 psi
Hrs on Bit 14 pH 8.0 Drillpipe AV 118 ft/sec
WOB (K/lbs) 19 WL (cc's) 6.2 Drillcollar AV 0 ftisec
RPM 55 Filter Cake 1 Nozzle Vel 110 fi/sec
Condition Sand (%) 0.250 [IMUD & CHEMICALS
Pulled For? | full barrel Solids (%) 5.000 {jMud cycle 142 min
Feet 28 Mud Co. Bariod ||Bottoms Up 71 min
hr 2.0 Mud Man C Tippetts [[Tanks 330 bbl's
Cum Hrs 14 Mud Up @ 5001 Hole Volume 326 bbl's
IBOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY TYPE ©OD/1D(in) LENGTH Jsigwix 1000| 130 1bs  [lsystem vol. 656 bbl's
TYPE OD /1D(in) LENGTH Avail WOB: 25 "Mud & Chemicals Added:
Bit 77/8 JtsDP in hole: 171 Caistic 1
Bit sub 61/4 0.20 m JtsDP on rcks: 80 Pac R 2
Core Barrel 61/2 28.00 m DP on Loc: 251 Soda Ash 2
x/o 61/4 250m DP Conn: 45"XH |[Sawdust 5
Uars 61/4 15.60 m DC Conn: 4.5"XH |[Envirothin 3
HWDP| 41/2 920.73 BHA Length: | 967.03 ft [WELL CONTROL  |[Mud Daily Cost $883
DRILLING OPERATIONS TIME BREAKDOWN JlLoss circ IMud Cum Cost $25,438
RU & TO Slip and cut DST RSPP-SPM [(SOLIDS CONTROL
Drill Actual Survey Fishing MACP(psi) 712 "Shaker Make Derrick
Reaming Logging Direct. Work (Calc Hole Fill "Shaker Mesh 80 x80
oring 13 1/2 |Run Casing Move Rig ct Hole Fill Centrifuge |Centrifuge
Rm Rathole Cementing Handle Tools 1 Lst BOP Drill: | 23/05/08 ||vol UF (gpm)
(Cond / Circ 1 woC Safety Mig Daylights U.F. (0pg) 151 15.1
ripping 7 NU BOP's Recover Core 11/2 raveyards .F. (ppg) 9 9
Lubricate Rig Test BOPs Lst Sfty Mtg 26/05/08 ([Hours/Days 4 4
Repair Rig Drill Out Cmt Total Hrs 24 Safety Topic general |{{Boiler Hrs: 0 (to 24:00)
24 HOUR SUMMARY report for: May 26/08-06:00 to May 27/08 - 06:00hrs

Note : 98% Core Recovery, 28.7 ft

Operations @ 27/05/08-06:00 hrs - Running in with bit {UD513}

RECEIVED

Rig service,held crossover meeting.Cut core#2 {6387 t0 6414'}.Circulated up sample.Hoisted core #2.Recovered core #2
28.2'.Serviced and laid down core barrel.Picked up motor/jars.Ran in with bit #5 UD 513{pdc}.

JUN 05 2008
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



600 - 17th Street, Suite #1900 S
Denver, Colorado, 80202

Baytex Energy USA Ltd

—DAILY DRIEENG-REPORT

CONFIDENTIAL

Office: 435-825-2777
Fax: 303-825-2790

WELL NAME © - |Devil'Mesa Unit 1-13  Qummenn . -DATE 26-May-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID. - - {43-037-318 DAY NO. 20
PROJECT LT L - AFE # - 17031788
|site Supervisor Iy . - 1435-220-0701 Start Depth 6387.0
Rig Manager Marshall Galleggi 505 486 6812 - End Depth 6412.0
Contractor - Rig # Pattgrson 747 o _Daily Progress 25.0
JLicense 43-037- 7 .
31879-0000 ) AVG ROP 217
Lease & road condition ._|dry & good [Weather | clear Temp 70
From |To Time Code Detailed Description of Daily Operations
6:00 6:30 0.50 7 Rig Servce ,held crossover meeting
6:30 19:30 13.00 4 Cut Core #2{6387 to 6414'}
19:30 20:30 1.00 5 Circulate up 6414’ sample
20:30 1:30 5.00 6 Hoist core #2
1:30 3:00 1.50 4 Recover Core #2 {28.2'}, 98% recovery
3:00 4:00 1.00 21 Seviced and laid down core barrel
4:00 6:00 2.00 6 Made up motor/Bit #5{UD513},Ran in with bit
6:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
24.00
Pumps - #1 - 9P-100, #2 - FB-1300 - GPS @ 97% Strokes 0 , SOLIDS CONTROL EQUIPMENT
#1 - 6" Liner @ 3.4 #2 - 6” Liner @ 4.28 - 856 JIshaker Make Derrick Swaco
Pump Pressure (Air) 1189 - - ‘J|Shaker Mesh 80 x80
Rotary/WOB 55. L Desander |Desilter Centifuge #1 |Centifuge #2
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE (Water) 0 Volume gpm |
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE 0 O.F 9 9
JIFLUIDS IN TANKS 600 UF 151 15.1
Mud Weight / Viscosity 91 hrs 4 4
v : " ' 24 Hour Look Ahead
|Fuel on Hand 1550 B Drllled 7 7/8" hole ahead to TD.Circulate and condition.Hoist to
|Fuel Delivered Today N Jlog.
Isurveys ~Depth— |Hnclinatic
See directional survey report
R ____LaslBQB Test..
DAILY TOTAL _ $28223
: ngj-lours From Spud: - . PREVIOUS TOTAL $946,903 .,
v ﬂo‘l’aﬁngﬂours . 'i"‘CUM,ULATIVE*TOTAI:““ T 9975126 T
. SUPERVISOR: " Terry BIacquuer PROJECTED AFE TOTAL -$989,973




Baytex Energy USA Lid

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

CONFIDENTIAL

Report For: Dave Friesen
WELL: Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 REPORT #: 19 | oae 25/05/08
Depth @06:00 : 6387 mKB I PROGRESS: 3ft in 1 rotating hours (last 24 hours)
Operations @06:00 : Cutting core # 2 at 6387 FOREMAN: TJ Blacquier MOBILE NO.:  403-548-1227
[lbaiLy cosT: $27,027 HOLE GND.: good WEATHER: clear TOOLPUSH: M Gallegos
CUM COST: $946,903 RIG/RIG# Patterson 747 TEMP.: 70 T.P.MOBILE:  505-486-6812
[FormaTion: — Hovensweep KB.ELEV. _ 6130.00 ROADS: good Geologist Bob Gould
BIT PERFORMANCE SURVEYS DRILLING FLUID  [[PUMPS
Bit No. 3C depth{mkb} inc Azmuth [fTime 18:00 |{Pump No. #1 #2
Size (in) 7 27/32 Depth(ft) tanks  [[Make Omega Omega
Mfg. Dowdco Density /ppg 9 Model L-750 L-750
Type C2299 Mud Grad 0.47  |[Liner X stk 6.5X8" 6.0X8"
Serial # CP-43 Vis sec/qrt 56 SPM
Nozzles PV 18 Pump Rate 0.00 0.00
From (mKB) 6384 YP Ib/100ft2 19 Pump Eff. 95% 95%
To (MKB) 6387 Gels 10/40  [fPump Press. psi
Hrs on Bit 1 pH 8.5 Drillpipe AV 0 ft/sec
WOB (k/lbs) 19 WL (cc's) 6 Drillcollar AV 0 ft/sec
RPM 55 Filter Cake 1 Nozzle Vel 0 ft/sec
Condition Sand (%) 0.05 [[MUD & CHEMICALS
Pulted For? Solids (%) 5 Mud Cycle 0 min
Feet 3 Mud Co. Bariod  ||Bottoms Up 0 min
ft/hr 1.0 Mud Man C Tippetts  [[Tanks 325 bbl's
Cum Hrs Y Mud Up @ 5001 Hole Volume 239 bbl's
BOTTOMHOLE ASSEMBLY TYPE OB /1D(in) LENGTH Strg Wt x 1000 130 Ibs “System Vol. 564 bbl's
TYPE OD /1D(in) LENGTH Avail WOB: 25 Mud & Chemicals Added:
Bit 77/8 JtsDP in hole: 169 Sawdust 10
Bit sub 61/4 0.20 m JtsDP on reks: 82
Core Barrel 61/2 28.00 m DP on Loc: 251
x/o 61/4 250 m DP Conn: 4.5"XH
Jars 6 1/4 15.60 m DG Conn: 4.5"XH
HWDP 41/2 920.73 BHA Length: 967.03 it [WELL CONTROL Mud Daily Cost $387
DRILLING OPERATIONS TIME BREAKDOWN JlLoss circ Mud Cum Cost $24,554
RU & TO Slip and cut DST RSPP-SPM SOLIDS CONTROL
Drill Actual Survey Fishing MACP(psi) 712 Shaker Make Derrick
Reaming Logging Direct. Work Calc Hole Fill Shaker Mesh 80 x80
Coring 11/2 Run Casing Handles Tools 41/2 ct Hole Fill Centrifuge |Centrifuge
Rm Rathole Cementing R/M Hole Lst BOP Drill: | 23/05/08 |[[vol UF (gpm)
Cond / Circ 21/2 {woc Safety Mig Daylights U.F. (ppg)
ripping 11 1/2 |NnuBOPS WO x/o 4 Graveyards O.F. (ppg)
Lubricate Rig Test BOPs Lst Sfty Mtg 24/05/08 ||Hours/Days
Repair Rig Drill Out Gmt Total Hrs 24 Safety Topic general |[Boiler Hrs: 0 (o 24:00)
24 HOUR SUMMARY report for: May 25/08-06:00 to May 26/08 - 06:00hrs

Iﬂaerations @ 26/05/08-06:00 hrs - Cutting core #2 at 6387 '

Circulated up sample.Hoisted to core.Laid down motor/jars.Picked up core barrel{discovered crack in x/o on barrel}.Laid
down core barrel.Waited on orders.Ran in HWDP{circulated}.Waited on new x/o's for core barrel.Hoisted HWDP.Picked up
& made up core barrel and jars.Ran in core barrel {fill pipe 2300',4000' & 6300'}.Circulated bottoms up trip gas at 6340'".
Washed to bottom 6345 to 6384".Drop ball,made up pup joint. Cout core #2 {6384 to 6387'}.

Note : Found hairline crack in x/o when making up core barrel, had new one flown in from Midland, Tx to Blanding Airstrip

RECEIVED
JUN 05 2008
DI, OF OlL, CAS & MINING




v DAILY DRILLING REPORT

CONFIDENTIAL

Baytex Energy USA Ltd
600 - 17th Street, Suite #1900 S Office: 435-825-2777
Denver, Colorado, 80202 Fax: 303-825-2790
WELL NAME . Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 R N ' b DATE 25-May-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID 43-037-31879-0000 T ) . 1. DAY NO. 19
|[PROJECT Gas Well R - AFE# 7031788
Isite Supervisor | Terry Blacquler = e - 1435-220-0701 ' Start Depth 6384.0
I_Ijlg Manager Marshall Gallegos : 505 486 6812 End Depth 6387.0
Contractor - Rig # Patterson 747 - o : : : Daily Progress - 3.0
License 43-037- | | . : .
31879-0000 - ____AVG ROP 3.00
|Lease & road condition_ __|dry & good S ﬁIWeather | clear | Temp 68
From {To Time Code Detailed Description of Daily Operations
6:00 7:00 1.00 5 Circulated up sample {6384’ core pt}
7:00 12:00 5.00 6 Hoisted to core
12:00 12:30 0.50 22 Laid down motor/jars
12:30 14:00 1.50 21 Make up core barrel{ found hair line crack in x/o0}
14:00 15:00 1.00 21 Laid down core barrel & jars
15:00 15:30 0.50 23 Wait on orders
15:30 16:30 1.00 6 Ran in HWDP
16:30 19:30 3.00 23 Waited on x/o for core barrel{ circulating}
19:30 20:30 1.00 6 Hoisted HWDP
20:30 22:00 1.50 21 Make up core barrel & jars
22:00 3:00 5.00 6 Run in with core barrel{ broke circ at 3200°,6000'}
3:00 4:30 1.50 5 Circulate out trip gas and wash to bottom{6345 to 6384'}
4:30 5:00 0.50 4 Drop ball,make up pup joint
5:00 6:00 1.00 4 Cut Core #2 {6384 to 6387’}
6:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
24.00
Pumps - #1 - 9P-100, #2 - FB-1300 - GPS @ 97% - Strokes 0 SOLIDS CONTROL EQUIPMENT
|#1-6" Liner @ 3.4 #2- 6" Liner @ 4.28 . 356 | .. gpm _|iShaker Make Derrick Swaco
Pump Pressure (Air) 1189 | - psi lfshaker Mesh 80 x80
Rotary/WOB ; 55 | za000 | Desander - [Desilter Centifuge #1 |Centifuge #2
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE (Water) ‘ _| __BBL _ Jvolume gpm
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE BBL .| OF
FLUIDS IN TANKS 600 BBL ] U.F
Mud@ht / Viscosity 9.3 _53 hrs
) ) ) 1 24 Hour Look Ahead
{Fuel on Hand 2450 galions {Cut core #2.Hoist and recover core.R.|.H with Pdc.Drilled 7 7/8"
Fuel Delivered Today gallons hole to TD
Surveys ‘ o D@th fnclination
See directional survey report
Last BOP Test | 18/65/08 ‘
T pally [ Accum | " DALYTOTAL. . [ $27,027 .
Rig Hours From Spud: - - .28 330 1 . PREVIOUS TOTAL . $019,875 -
oo T R‘o‘fa‘ﬂﬁg_ﬂaﬁrs o " T 1 : 154_0 R '"”CUMUL"AT]VETOTA STy ‘*“$9“46§'9’03‘“ T
o " SUPERVISOR: ’ Terry Blacquier " PROJECTED AFETOTAL $989,973




CONFIDENTIAL

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES )
DIVISION OF Ol , GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU 076834
6 IF INDIAN ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS L
Do net use This torem for proposals to drilt new welis, significantly deepen exisiing wells below current batiom-hele depth, reenter plugged wells, or to 7INT or GA AGREEMENT HAME
ol horzontal alerals. Uss APPLICATION FOR PERWIT TO DRILL form for such proposais ' Devil Mesa Unit UTU-085849X
1 TYPEUR WELL 8. WELL NAME ww NUMBER.
ouwelr [  caswew /]  OTHER Devil Mesa Unit 1-13
2. NAME OF OFERATOR. . ARl NUMBER.
Baytex Energy USA Ltd : 4303731879
3, ADORESS OF OPERATOR. PHONE NUMBER. 0. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDGAT
800 17th Street Suile 1900 ., Denver srgs CO 580202 (303) 8256-2777 undesignated
4 LOCATION OF WELL
FooTAGES AT SURFAce: 1522' FNL 2419 FWL SE/4 NW/4 county- San Juan
QTRAITR SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE. MERIDUN: Srfyl Nwfy SeEc il T36S, R 23 € STATE: UTAR
n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION -
[ NOTICE OF WTENT ] acioze ] peeeen [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
{Submi in Dupiicate) L] arercasing [ rracTure TREAT [} SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date workwill sttt [T GASING REPAR [J newconstrucTION [3 TeMPORARILY ABANDON
[] crance To PREVIOUS PLANS [ oreraToR crancE [ ruee repar
] cHance TueNG [ PLucanp asanoon [] venrorFLARE
[/l suBSEQUENT REPORT [[] crance weLL NaME [J rusesaex ] vTer DisposaL
{Subrmit Oniginal Form Oniy)
- son [[] crance wew status [[] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [} warerswuT-OFF
o of work compiats
[] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE [ omer monthly status of
5/30/2008 ] conveatweL Tvee [] wrecomeirte . miererent eORMATION each drilling well

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinant details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Spud date 5/9/2008 20:30H with Patterson UT| Rig 747

Tubular and cementing details.

Surface casing: Drilled 11" hole to 2178', Ran 52 jts, 2180.6", 8 5/8" 24 Ib/ft, J-55, ST&C, 8rnd casing, landed at 2178’,
cemented with 380 sks (198 bbls) San Juan PRB Il w/ 0.125 Ib/sk polyflake (11.5 lb/gal). tailed in with 120 sks (38.5 bbls) of
San Juan PRB 1l w! 0.125 Ibisk Polyflake (13.5 Ib/gal). Plug down May 13, 2008 01:57H. 50 bbls good cement returns to
surface.

Production casing: Drilled 7 7/8" hole to 6595', Ran 156 jts, 6597.55', 4 1/2", 11.6 Ibfft, J-565, LT&C, 8rnd casing,landed at
6595', cemented with 620 sks (310 bbis), standard cement (11.5 Ib/gal} + 3% Econolite + 0.125 Ib/sk Polyflake + 10 Ib/sk
Gilsonite, tailed in with 292 sks (80 bbis) POZ 50:50, 12.5 Ib/gal with 0.2% Halad-R + 0.125 Ib/sk Polyflake + 0.3% D-AIR +
0.2% CFR-3. Plug down May 29, 2008 21:58H. 60 bbis good cement retums to surface.

Logged with Weatherford MPD-MDN-MAI-MFE-CMI 5/272008 ECEIVE D
Rig Released 5/30/2008 10:00H JUN 04 2008
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
NAME (BLEASE PRINT) David Friesen nme Manager, Drilling and Compietions
SIGNATURE ____ \ - oare  6/4/2008
'] _
{this space for State use only)

(52000) (See Instructions on Revesse Side)



BAYTEX

ENERGY USA LTD

June 26, 2008 1 ]
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining %
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801 4’
Attn: Carol Daniels

RE: Baytex Energy USA Ltd
June 2008 — Week 3 Drilling Reports
Devil Mesa Unit #1-13 Well
API Well No. 43-037-31879
Section 13, T36S — R23E, SENW
San Juan County, Utah

Dear Ms. Daniels,

Please find copies of the Baytex Energy USA Ltd Drilling Reports for the dates listed
below:

June 2008 — Week 3

Sunday 6/15/08
Monday 6/16/08
Tuesday 6/17/08

Wednesday  6/18/08
Thursday 6/19/08
Friday 6/20/08
Saturday 6/21/08

If you have any questions or concerns please don’t hesitate to call me at: 303 825-2777.

Lokelani F. Narte

Enclosures

Infs RECEIVED
JUN 30 2008
DIV, OF QiL, {4 & -
Z:\Memos\C\Carol Daniels\Jun 25.doc 600 Seventcenth Strect | Telephone 303.825.2777
Suite 1900 South Facsimile 303.825.2790

Denver, CO 80202 www.baytex.ab.ca



‘ CONFIDENTIAL
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DECCA CONSULTING

500 - 5th Avenue SW 2010 Calgary, Alberta T2P 2T8

403-263-3373 Office
403-263-3374 Fax

WELL NAME Devil Mesa 1-13 DATE 15-Jun-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID SE/4-NW/4 SEC13 T36S-R23E DAY NO. 1
PROJECT COMPLETION AFE # 8041732
FORMATION (s) Upper Ismay Upper Ismay EHonecker Trail TD 6529'
PERFORATION (s) : : PBTD 6529'
July 16-2008| 07:00 hrs. - |Rig up Rig and Equipment, Run Bond Log with Pure Energy Wireline. Rig & Num Key 0077
License H2S Oppm
Lease & road condition |Good, Dry and Dusty Temp 90F
DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS
Move Key Energy Rig from Grand Jucntion to Devil Mesa # 1-13 on Friday June 13-2008
Spot Rig on Location.
Fly to Denver, rent truck, drive to Devil Mesa # 1-13
RECEIVED
JUN 30 2008
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
FLUID SUMMARY ( BBLS) Zone 1 Zone 2 DAILY COST ANALYSIS
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE SERVICE AMOUNT
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE Decca Consulting $ 1,500.00
FLUIDS IN TANKS Key Energy Rig 0077 $ 6,519.33
TOTAL LOAD FLUID
RECOVERY LAST 24 HRS.
CUMULATIVE RECOVERY
(-)Load fluid: ( +) for new fluid.
GAS PRODUCED LAST 24 HRS
CUMULATIVE GAS PRODUCED
GAS FLARED LAST 24 HRS
CUMULATIVE GAS FLARED ( hrs )
DAILY TOTAL $ 8,019.33
Dally Accum |PREVIOUS TOTAL '
Rig Hours: CUMULATIVE TOTAL K 8,019.33
SUPERVISOR: Rick Thomson AFE TOTAL




CONFIDENTIAL

DECCA CONSULTING

500 - 5th Avenue SW 2010 Calgary, Alberta T2P 2T8

403-263-3373 Office
403-263-3374 Fax

WELL NAME Devil Mesa 1-13 DATE 16-Jun-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID SE/4-NW/4 SEC13 T36S-R23E ~ |DAY NO. 2
PROJECT COMPLETION AFE # 8041732
FORMATION (s) Upper Ismay |Upper Ismay iHonecker Trail TD 6529’
PERFORATION (s) PBTD 6529’
July 17-2008| 07:00 hrs. Rig & Num Key 0077
License H2S Oppm
Lease & road condition |Good, Dry and Dusty Temp 90F

DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS

07:00
07:15

07:30

08:30

14:00
15:00
16:00
17:00

Service and Start Rig. ‘

Hold Pre-job Safety Meeting with all personal on Location.

Check for any Hazards around well head area and on Location.

Spot and rig in Rig and equipment, to Baytex Energy, OH&S, Government, HSE Polices.
Can not stand Rig one guy line anchor is missing.

Guy line anchor buried when cat back bladed location.

Attempted to locate anchor with no success.

Wait on LGR Anchor truck to install new anchor.

Perform surface Csg vent Test (15mins Good Test)

Rig in pump and tank.

Add 20gals clayfix two to 240bbls fresh water.

LGR Anchor truck install and pull test anchor to 20.000ibs.

Stand Rig, hook up guy lines to anchors

Nipple down well head, nipple up Glass 2- 3000psi double gate hydraulic BOPS. ( Function Test )
Rig in Pure Energy Wireline unit, RIH 3.375" Gauge ring to PBTD 6529'kb.

RIH Cement Bond Log complete with GR-CCL Logs.

Correlate to open hole density log dated 27-May-2008.

Log from PBTD- 6529kb ( Hole Full ) to 5950' Honecker Trail formation, 5934.69' Marker jt to 5000' ( No Cement Top ).

POOH and Lay down logging tools and lubricator.
Close Blind Rams, secure well.

20:30 SDFN RECEIVED
JUN 30 2008
FLUID SUMMARY ( BBLS) Zone 1 Zone 2 DAILY EUSOANALYSAS & MIN!
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE 240 SERVICE AMOUNT
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE Decca Consulting $ 1,500.00
FLUIDS IN TANKS 240 Key Energy Rig 0077 $ 6,471.90
TOTAL LOAD FLUID Benco Qil Services Inc ( Anchor ) $ 1,506.00
RECOVERY LAST 24 HRS. Ebberts Construction ( Water ) $ 1,800.00
CUMULATIVE RECOVERY Pure Energy ( Wireline ) $ 8,892.49
(-) Load fluid:  ( +) for new fluid.
GAS PRODUCED LAST 24 HRS
CUMULATIVE GAS PRODUCED
GAS FLARED LAST 24 HRS
CUMULATIVE GAS FLARED ( hrs)
DAILY TOTAL $ 20,170.39
Daily Accum |PREVIOUS TOTAL $ 8,019.33
Rig Hours: 13.5 13.5 CUMULATIVE TOTAL $ 28,189.72
SUPERVISOR: Rick Thomson AFE TOTAL




DECCA CONSULTING

500 - 5th Avenue SW 2010 Calgary, Alberta T2P 2T8

403-263-3373 Office
403-263-3374 Fax

WELL NAME Devil Mesa 1-13 DATE June 17-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID SE/4-NW/4 SEC13 T36S-R23E DAY NO. 3
PROJECT COMPLETION AFE # 8041732
FORMATION (s) Upper Ismay lUpper Ismay :'Honecker Trail TD 6529
PERFORATION (s) 6242'- 6251'- 6232'-6238' ! PBTD 6529
June 18-2008] 07:00 hrs. [Nipple-up wellhead, Drop Bar, RIH with Recorders, Test well. Rig & Num Key 0077
License H2S Oppm
Lease & road condition |Good, Dry and Dusty Temp 90F

DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS

07:00
07:15
07:30

Service and Start Rig.

Check well head pressure 0psi.
10:30
11:00

12:00
13:00

Inspect perf guns , all shots fired.

13:30 Rig out wireline.

14:00

18:30
19:30

Change out weight indicator on rig.

Hold Pre-job Safety Meeting with all personal on Location.

Nipple up Washington head, work floor and power tongs.
Tally, drift and M/u Halliburton on/off connecter complete with 1.875" X nipple, 4 1/2" Otis PLS packer, 4' -2 3/8" pup jt,
Glass shear disc sub and wireline Re-entry guide.
Tally, drift and RIH 190 jts 2 3/8" J-55 4.70Ib/ft tbg, 2 x 6' - 2 3/8" pup jts and 1 jt 2 3/8" tbg ( 191jts in hole total )
Set packer @ 6226.32'kb in 17k compression. .
Press Test packer to 200psi low for 10mins ( Good Test ) 1000psi high 10mins ( Good Test ) Bleed offBr&QrE’ VE D

Wait on 4" suckshan hose for Rig pump to Pressure Test 4.5" csg and BOPs.
Transport truck held up @ road construction.
Press Test csg to 200psi low for 10mins ( Good Test ) 1000psi high 10mins ( Good Test ) Bleed off Pressure.
Rig in Pure Energy wireline. Hold Pre-job Safety Meeting.
RIH with 9' x 3-3/8" perf gun with 4 shots per ft, 25 gram SDP charges.

Perforate upper Ismay formation @ 6242' - 6251' ( No gas, Opsi well head pressure )
Perforate upper Ismay formation @ 6232' - 6238’ ( No gas, Opsi well head pressure )
Correlate to Pure energy RA, CBL, GR, and CCL Log Dated 06/16/08.

20:30 Secure well SDFN. JUN 3
0 2008
DIV. OF Ol GAS 2 msinge
FLUID SUMMARY ( BBLS) Zone 1 Zone 2 DAILY COST ANALYSIS -
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE 240 SERVICE AMOUNT
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE Decca Consulting $ 1,500.00
FLUIDS IN TANKS 240 Key Energy Rig 0077 $ 6,638.44
TOTAL LOAD FLUID Pure Energy ( Wireling ) $ 6,849.62
RECOVERY LAST 24 HRS.
CUMULATIVE RECOVERY
{-) Load fluild: ( + ) for new fluid.
GAS PRODUCED LAST 24 HRS
CUMULATIVE GAS PRODUCED
GAS FLARED LAST 24 HRS
CUMULATIVE GAS FLARED ( hrs)
DAILY TOTAL $ 14,988.06
Daily Accum |PREVIOUS TOTAL $ 28,189.72
Rig Hours: 135 27 CUMULATIVE TOTAL $ 43,177.78
SUPERVISOR: Rick Thomson AFE TOTAL




D ECCA CONSU LTI NG 403-263-3373 Office

500 - 5th Avenue SW 2010 Calgary, Alberta T2P 2T8 403-263-3374 Fax
WELL NAME Devil Mesa 1-13 DATE June 18-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID SE/4-NW/4 SEC13 T36S-R23E DAY NO. 4
PROJECT COMPLETION AFE # 8041732
FORMATION (s) Upper Ismay |Upper Ismay EHonecker Trail TD 6529’
PERFORATION (s) 6242'- 6251"- 6232'-6238' ; PBTD 6529'

June 19-2008] 07:00 hrs. |Pull tandem recorders, Acid stimulation on Upper Ismay perfs, Test well. Rig & Num Key 0077
License H2S Oppm
Lease & road condition |Good, Dry and Dusty Temp 90F

DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS

07:00
07:15
07:30

08:45

08:50
08:55
09:00
09:05
09:10
09:15
09:20
09:25
09:30
09:35
09:40
09:45

10:10
10:20
10:30

11:00

Service and Start Rig.

Hold Pre-job Safety Meeting with all personal on Location.

Check well head pressure 0psiTbg, Opsi Csg.

Rig out work floor and power tongs.

Nipple down BOP.

Nipple up wellhead.

Install 1" adjustable choke on return line.

Drop 10' x 1" bar to break Glass disc.

Read and Record Tbg pressure, Csg press 0psi.

33psi

35psi

41psi

49psi

56psi

62psi

71psi

78psi

84psi

88psi

94psi

98psi

Rig in Spicer slick line unit and run 1.875 plug and tandem recorders and set in on/off profile @ 6222'kb.
117psi o
125psi RtCEiVED
138psi

Shut well in. JUN 3 0 2008

Rig out slick line unit.

Secure Well, SDFN for pressure build-up DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING

FLUID SUMMARY ( BBLS) Zone 1 Zone 2 DAILY COST ANALYSIS

TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE 240 SERVICE AMOUNT

TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE Decca Consulting

1,500.00

FLUIDS IN TANKS 240 Key Energy Rig 0077 (8 hr min)

4,438.32

TOTAL LOAD FLUID Ebberts Construction ( Sump pump )

20.00

RECOVERY LAST 24 HRS. Key Rentals ( BOP)

360.00

CUMULATIVE RECOVERY Colorado Tubular ( 2 3/8 thg 6356' )

37,184.00

(-) Load fluid:  ( + ) for new fluid. Spicer Wireline Service ( Slick line )

€A |en |ep |n | R |

4,226.00

GAS PRODUCED LAST 24 HRS

CUMULATIVE GAS PRODUCED

GAS FLARED LAST 24 HRS

" |CUMULATIVE GAS FLARED ( hrs )

DAILY TOTAL $ 47,728.32

Daily Accum__ |PREVIOUS TOTAL 43,177.78

“»

Rig Hours: 8 35 CUMULATIVE TOTAL $ 90,906.10

SUPERVISOR: Rick Thomson AFE TOTAL




DECCA CONSULTING

500 - 5th Avenue SW 2010 Calgary, Alberta T2P 278

403-263-3373 Office
403-263-3374 Fax

WELL NAME Devil Mesa 1-13 DATE June 19-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID SE/4-NW/4 SEC13 T36S-R23E DAY NO. 5
PROJECT COMPLETION AFE # 8041732
FORMATION (s) Upper Ismay |Upper Ismay EHonecker Trail TD 6529
PERFORATION (s) 6242'- 6251"- 6232™-6238" | : PBTD 6529'
June 20-2008| 07:00 hrs. |Swab and test Upper Ismay Zone. Rig & Num Key 0077
|Llcense H2S Oppm
Lease & road condition jGood, Dry and Dusty Temp 90F

DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS

07:00
07:15
07:30

Service and Start Rig.

08:10
09:15

l{10:00

11:15
11:28

Work Pressure.
|l14:00

ISIP= 2674psi, ISIP 5 mns=2500psi.
14:30 Bleed off Csg, Rig out Halliburton.
15:00
15:50
15:55
16:00
16:05
16:15
16:30
17:00
|{17:15

75psi
2 psi
0 psi
0 psi
70 psi
0 psi

acid, gas and water returns.
acid, gas returns.
Observe well

Bleed off gas to rig tank.
Well dead.

Total load fluid recovered= 35bbls.
18:30 Lay down swab lubricator, secure well.
19:00 SDEN

Pull 4 swabs fluid level 2700'-3100" pulled from 3700'-4100'

Hold Pre-job Safety Meeting with all personal on Location.
Check well head pressure 570psiTbg, Opsi Csg.

Rig in Spicer Slickline unit to pull recorders.

Check for fluid level when running in hole ( No Fluid in hole )
Latch on to recorders @ 6222'kb 600psi SITP.

Pull recorders and run a Gradient log every 500’ for 2mins.

Rig out slick line, 600psi SITP, down load data from recorders,
Btm hole press = 718.5psi, Btim hole temp = 131.5 deg F.

Rig in Halliburton for 15% HCL acid stimulation on Upper Ismay Perforations.
Hold Pre-job safety meeting with all personal on location.
Press test surface lines to 4000psi ( Good Test) Press up on 4.5 csg to 1400psi.
590psi SITP, Pump 15% HCL acid @ 2 bbls/min.

Pump 20.8bbls acid pressure increase to 3000psi max pressure.

Well Dead. Close Well in Rig in swab equipment.

Formation break down 2888psi @ 1bbl/min, Injection rate = 2800psi @ 2bbls/min.
Pump a total of 31bbls 15% HCL acid and flush with 24bbls clay inhibited water.

2050psi SITP, Flow thg to Rig tank on 1" adjustable choke @ 5psi 100% water.
270psi gas to surface decrease to 1/2" choke, acid, gas and water returns. ( 22 bbls returned )
150psi open to 1" choke, acid, gas and water returns.
(5.5 bbls returned ) 27.5bbls total

( recover 7.5bbls water )

RECEIVED

JUN 30 2008

DIV. OF 0iL, s & MINING

FLUID SUMMARY ( BBLS) Zone 1 Zone 2 DAILY COST ANALYSIS
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE 240 SERVICE AMOUNT
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE Decca Consulting $ 1,500.00
FLUIDS IN TANKS 240 Key Energy Rig 0077 $ 5,991.46
TOTAL LOAD FLUID 55 Ebberts Construction ( Sump pump ) $ 20.00
RECOVERY LAST 24 HRS. Key Rentals ( BOP) $ 360.00
CUMULATIVE RECOVERY Halliburton $ 16,450.23
(-) Load fluid: _ ( +) for new fluid. Spicer Wireline Service ( Slick line ) $ 1,935.50
GAS PRODUCED LAST 24 HRS
CUMULATIVE GAS PRODUCED
GAS FLARED LAST 24 HRS
CUMULATIVE GAS FLARED ( hrs)
DAILY TOTAL $ 26,257.19
Daily Accum JPREVIOUS TOTAL $ 90,906.10
Rig Hours: 12 47 CUMULATIVE TOTAL $ 117,163.29
SUPERVISOR: Rick Thomson AFE TOTAL




DECCA CONSULTING

500 - 5th Avenue SW 2010 Calgary, Alberta T2P 2T8

CONFIDENTIAL

403-263-3373 Office
403-263-3374 Fax

WELL NAME Devil Mesa 1-13

DATE

June 20-2008

UNIQUE WELL ID SE/4-NW/4 SEC13 T36S-R23E

DAY NO,

6

PROJECT COMPLETION

AFE #

8041732

FORMATION (s) Upper Ismay IUpper Ismay EHonecker Trail

TD

6529'

PERFORATION (s) 6242'- 6251'- 6232'-6238" ! :

PBTD

6529’

June 21-2008' 07:00 hrs. |Set plug, Test, Nd well head, N/u BOP, Test Csg and Pkr, POOH, Perf, RIH

Rig & Num

Key 0077

Jucense |

H2S

Oppm

Lease & road condition |Good, Dry and Dusty

Temp

90F

DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS

07:00 Service and Start Rig.

07:15 Hold Pre-job Safety Meeting with all personal on Location.
07:30 Check well head pressure 550psiTbg, Opsi Csg.

Install 1" adjustable choke

Open Tbg to rig tank on 1" choke. 550psi thg pressure.
Bleed down from 550psi to Opsi in 3mins.

Rig out 1" adjustable choke.

Rig up to swab.

Fluid level 2400 pull 8 swabs, swab fluid down to 6000’
Recover 16bbls gas cut, spent acid fluid.

Total load fluid = 55bbls, total load fluid recovered = 51bbls
Dry Hole.

Shut well in.

Rig out swab equipment.

20psi, Open and vent well on 12/64" adjustable choke to rig tank.
10psi, slight trace of gas, no fluid.

15psi, slight trace of gas, no fluid.

18psi, slight trace of gas, no fluid.

18psi, slight trace of gas, no fluid.

17psi, slight trace of gas, no fluid. Secure well SDFN

07:50

12:00

12:30
13:00
13:30
14:00
14:30
15:00

RECEIVED
JUN 3¢ 2008

DN.OF OIL, CAS & MiniNG

FLUID SUMMARY ( BBLS) Tank # 1 Tank # 2

DAILY COST ANALYSIS

TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE 190 SERVICE

AMOUNT

TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE Decca Consulting

1,500.00

FLUIDS IN TANKS 120 51 Key Energy Rig 0077

4,503.30

TOTAL LOAD FLUID 55

Ebberts Construction ( Sump pump )

20.00

|RECOVERY LAST 24 HRS. 16 Key Rentals ( BOP)

& |~ | e [P

360.00

CUMULATIVE RECOVERY 51

1(-) Load fluid:  ( +) for new fluid.

GAS PRODUCED LAST 24 HRS

CUMULATIVE GAS PRODUCED

GAS FLARED LAST 24 HRS

CUMULATIVE GAS FLARED (hrs)

DAILY TOTAL
PREVIOUS TOTAL
CUMULATIVE TOTAL
AFE TOTAL

Daily Accum
Rig Hours: 8 55
SUPERVISOR: Rick Thomson

R

6,383.30

L

117,163.29

$ 123,546.59




DECCA CONSULTING CONFIDENTIAL

500 - 5th Avenue SW 2010 Calgary, Alberta T2P 2T8

403-263-3373 Office
403-263-3374 Fax

WELL NAME Devil Mesa 1-13 DATE

June 21-2008

UNIQUE WELL ID SE/4-NW/4 SEC13 T36S-R23E DAY NO.

7

PROJECT COMPLETION AFE #

8041732

6529'

FORMATION (s) Upper Ismay IUpper Ismay ‘Honecker Trail TD
PERFORATION (s) 6242'- 6251'- 6232'-6238" PBTD

6529

June 22-08 | 07:00 hrs. |Rev circ on to PLS packer, POOH, RIH with WRP and set, test, dump bail, |Rig & Num

Key 0077

ILicense

RIH selective acid tools. H2S

Oppm

Lease & road condition |Good, Dry and Dusty Temp

90F

DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS

07:00
07:15
07:30

l 07:40

10:00

11:00
12:00

I 12:30

Service and Start Rig.

Hold Pre-job Safety Meeting with all personal on Location.

Check well head pressure 370psiTbg, Opsi Csg.

Bleed off gas head to rig tank on 2" line.

Rig in Spicer slick line unit.

RIH 1.875 Otis XXplug.

F.L @ 4200

Set in Xnipple @ 6222'kb

Rig out Slick line.

Conduct Neg test on thg ( Good Test )

Fill tbg with 18bbls clay inhibited fresh water.

Press Test plug to 2000psi for 10mins ( Good Test )

Bleed off Pressure.

N/d well head N/u BOP and function test, rig in work floor, power tongs.
Press Test 4.5" csg and BOP to 3000psi for 10mins ( Good Test )
3 bbils to fill hole.

Remove Tbg hanger

Come off PLS packer with on/off tool.

13:00 POOH 1jt 2 3/8" 4.70Ib/ft J-55 EUE thg, 2 x 6' pup jts + 95 stds 2 3/8" tbg and on /off connecter.
15:30 Rig up Pure Energy Wireline BOP and lubricator.
RIH with 3" dump glass bottom bailer with 3' of Chicken grit in 4.5" csg.
Tag PLS packer @ 6212'kb with -13" Correlation Correction.
Dump bail Chicken grit.
Correlate to Pure energy RA, CBL, GR, and CCL Log Dated 06/16/08.
17:00 RIH with 3.778" gauge ring tag @ 6209'kb, -13' Correlation Correction.
18:00 Rig out wireline.
18:30 Make up PLS Packer on /off tool. RECFE‘\!EF
RIH 95stds 2 3/8" tbg 1 single and 12.33" in on 192jt. et Vi
Tag Chicken grit on top of PLS packer @ 6224'kb ( Tbg tally ) with no Correlation Correction. JUN 3
POOCH 12.33" to 6208.85'kb 191jts in hole. 0 2008
21:00 Secure well SDFN. i
DIV.OF QIt, cag & Ay
FLUID SUMMARY ( BBLS) Tank # 1 Tank #2 DAILY COST ANALYSIS
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE 280 SERVICE AMOUNT
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE Decca Consulting $ 1,500.00
JFLUIDS IN TANKS 190 51 Key Energy Rig 0077 $ 6,790.56
TOTAL LOAD FLUID 23 Ebberts Construction ( Sump pump ) $ 20.00
RECOVERY LAST 24 HRS. Key Rentals { BOP) $ 360.00
CUMULATIVE RECOVERY Ebberts Construction ( H20 ) $ 1,122.00
l(-) Load fluid: __( +) for new fluid. Pure Energy $ 6,553.50
GAS PRODUCED LAST 24 HRS
CUMULATIVE GAS PRODUCED
GAS FLARED LAST 24 HRS
CUMULATIVE GAS FLARED ( hrs)
DAILY TOTAL $ 16,346.06
Daily Accum |PREVIOUS TOTAL $ 123,546.59
Rig Hours: 14 69 CUMULATIVE TOTAL $ 139,892.65
SUPERVISOR: Rick Thomson AFE TOTAL
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BAYTEX

ENERGY USA LTD

July 1, 2008

Diviston of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801 collf lnwrln’

Attn: Carol Daniels

RE: Baytex Energy USA Ltd
June 2008 — Week 4 Drilling Reports
Devil Mesa Unit #1-13 Well
API Well No. 43-037-31879
Section 13, T36S — R23E, SENW
San Juan County, Utah

Dear Ms. Daniels,

Please find copies of the Baytex Energy USA Ltd Drilling Reports for the dates listed
below:

June 2008 — Week 4

Sunday 6/22/08
Monday 6/23/08
Tuesday 6/24/08

Wednesday  6/25/08
Thursday 6/26/08
Friday 6/27/08
Saturday 6/28/08

If you have any questions or concerns please don’t hesitate to call me at: 303 825-2777.

Sincerely,

okelani F. Narte

- RECE\\IED
In/s
JUL 03 2008
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

Z:\Memos\C\Carol Daniels\Jul 01.doc 600 Sceventeenth Strect | Telephone 303.825.2777
Suite 1900 South Facsimile 303.825.2790
Denver, CO 80202 www.baytex.ab.ca



DECCA CONSULTING

500 - 5th Avenue SW 2010 Calgary, Alberta T2P 2T8

CONTFIDENTIAL

4% - 0271 )
— > S 22

403-263-3373 Office
403-263-3374 Fax

@

WELL NAME Devil Mesa 1-13 DATE June 22-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID SE/4-NW/4 SEC13 T36S-R23E DAY NO. 8
PROJECT COMPLETION AFE # 8041732
FORMATION (s) Upper Ismay |Upper Ismay ‘Honecker Trail ™ 6529'
PERFORATION (s) 6242'- 6251"- 6232'-6238' 16210-6219- 6182'6187"  :6075'6098’ PBTD 6529'
June 23-08 | 07:00 hrs. |Cont to RIH selective acid tools. Acidize Upper Ismay and Honecker Trail Rig & Num Key 0077
|License Perfs, POOH and RIH with XN nipple and N/d BOP and N/u Well head, Swab. |H2S Oppm
Lease & road condition |Good, Dry and Dusty Temp 90F
DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS
07:00 Service and Start Rig.
07:15 Hold Pre-job Safety Meeting with all personal on Location.
07:30 Check well head pressure OpsiTbg, Opsi Csg.
Install Washington rubber in Washington head.
Rev circ down with clay inhibited water @ 3 bbls/min, 300psi.
Tag chicken grit @ 6221'.18kb. ( Tbg Tally )
Wash down to 6218'kb tag PLS packer.
Circ a total of 66 bbls clay inhibit water.
09:00 Latch on to PLS packer with on /off tool.
09:15 POOH and Stand in Derrick 96 stds 2 7/8" 4.70Ib/ft J-55 EUE Thg, break down on/off tool and PLS packer./
PLS packer rubbers good shape ( No rubber loss in hole )
11:30 Rig in Pure Energy BOP and Lubricator.
RIH With Halliburton WRP 41/2" Bridge plug and set @ 6226'kb ( Wireline Depth )
13:00 POOH Wireline.
13:30 Rig out wire line lubricator.
13:45 Press Test 4.5" Csg and BOPS to 200psi low and 3000psi for 10mins, 28bbls clay inhibit water to fill hole ( Good Test )
14:15 RIH on Wireline with 3" OD dump bailer and dump bail 4' of chicken grit on top of 41/2" Bridge plug.
POOH with baylor.
14:30 Safety meeting with all personal on location.
14:45 RIH with 3 3/8" perf guns with 6-spf, 25gram DP charges, with 60 deg phasing.
Perf Ismay formation @ 6210'-6219'kb 9' = 54 shots. ( Well on Vacuum ) R
Correlate to RACB,GR+ CCL Log Dated 06/16/08. E C:: f !gf;"f’i'i‘
POOH and RIH with 3 3/8" perf guns with 6-spf, 25gram DP charges, with 60 deg phazing. o b
Honecker Formation from 6075 - 6098'kb ( Wireline Depth ) 1. JUL 0 3
Miss Run Perfs gun will not fire, POOH with guns. 2 2008
17:30 Inspect perf gun on surface, short in gun, repair. D
18:30 RIH to perf Honecker Formation from 6075 - 6098'kb ( Wireline Depth ) W OF O"" GAS & M{MNQ
19:00 Fire Guns, Correlate to RACB,GR+ CCL Log Dated 06/16/08. ( Well on Vacuum )
19:30 Rig out Wireline.
20:00 M/u and RIH Halliburton Pin Point Injector Packer w/ 25" spacing, complete with standing valve and bypass valve.
and RIH 32stds 2 7/8" tbg to 2116.64kb.
21:00 Secure well SDFN.
FLUID SUMMARY ( BBLS) Tank # 1 Tank # 2 DAILY COST ANALYSIS
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE 310 SERVICE AMOUNT
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE Decca Consulting $ 1,500.00
|FLuIDS IN TANKS 95 51 Key Energy Rig 0077 $ 7,070.56
TOTAL LOAD FLUID 94 Ebberts Construction ( Sump pump ) $ 20.00
|RECOVERY LAST 24 HRS. Key Rentals ( BOP ) $ 360.00
CUMULATIVE RECOVERY Pure Energy ( Wireline ) 3 15,154.97
I(-) Load fluid: _ ( +) for new fluid.
GAS PRODUCED LAST 24 HRS
CUMULATIVE GAS PRODUCED
GAS FLARED LAST 24 HRS
CUMULATIVE GAS FLARED ( hrs)
DAILY TOTAL $ 24,105.53
Daily Accum JPREVIOUS TOTAL $ 139,892.65
Rig Hours: 14 69 CUMULATIVE TOTAL $ 163,998.18
SUPERVISOR: Rick Thomson AFE TOTAL

q



CONFIDENTIAL
D ECCA CONS U LTI NG 7/ 1 \ l]“‘dh 4 403-263-3373 Office
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WELL NAME Devil Mesa 1-13 DATE June 23-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID SE/4-NW/4 SEC13 T36S-R23E DAY NO. 9
PROJECT COMPLETION AFE # 8041732
FORMATION (s) Upper Ismay |Upper Ismay 1Honecker Trail TD 6222'kb
PERFORATION (s) 6242'- 6251'- 6232'-6238' 16210-6219™- 6182'6187'  16075'6098" PBTD 6529'kb
June 24-08 | 07:00 hrs. |Check well head pressure, POOH with selective aciding tools, RIH with Rig & Num Key 0077
|License 1.875XN nipple and 2 3/8" 4.70lb/ft J-55 Tbg, N/d BOP, N/u well head, Test H28 Oppm
Lease & road condition |Good, Dry and Dusty Temp 90F
DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS
07:00 Service and Start Rig.
07:15 Hold Pre-job Safety Meeting with all personal on Location.
07:30 Check well head pressure 400psiTbg, 300psi Csg, bleed off gas head well stable.
07:45 Install Washington head rubber.
08:00 RIH 2 3/8" 4.70 lb/ft J-55 EUE tbg from 2116.64'kb.
09:00 Tag T.D. @ 6223.40kb with Halliburton Pin Paint Injector Packer w/ 25" spacing, complete with standing valve and bypass,
valve, permanent bridge plug set @ 6226'kb, top of chicken grit @ 6222'kb
POOH 3 stds 2 3/8" thg ( 194.22') to a depth of 6029kb, into blank csg to test packers on PIP tool, set packers.
10:30 Fill hole with 16bbls clay inhibited fresh water, test packers to 200psi low 10mins ( Good Test )
Press test to 3000psi , press bleed down 500psi in 1 min. unset packers POOH 1jt set packers @ 5996.58kb.
11:15 Press test to 200low for 10mins ( Good Test ) press test to 3000psi 10mins ( Good test )
11:45 Unset packers RIH and tag btm @ 6223.40kb.
POOH and set packers bottom rubber @ 6221.40kb top rubber @ 6196kb, perfs, Upper Ismay @ 6210'kb-6219'kb
12:30 Pre-job safety meeting with all personal on location. ( 10 men head count )
13:00 Press test Halliburton surface lines to 4000psi. ( Good Test )
13:30 Pump 8.8 bbls 15% acid, have communications on Casing 1592psi, Tbg pressure =1795psi.
Stop pump, discuss with Dave Friesen D&C Manger Baytex.
13:35 Pump 750 gal 15% acid @ 2bbls/min into Upper Ismay @ 6210'kb-6219'kb, thg pressure 2861psi, casing press 2750'psi
ISIP = 256PSI, 5 min ISIP 2489psi. No Break. displace with 13.85bbls clay inhibited water.
14:00 Bleed off thg pressure 2489psi -Opsi, Bleed off casing press 2518psi-0 psi
| 14:30 Unset packers POOH 22' bottom rubber @ 6199'kb top rubber @ 6174'.
15:00 Pump 420gal 15% acid into Upper Ismay perfs, dis place with 10bbls clay inhibited water.
Pump @ 2bbls/min 2609psi tbg Opsi csg no break. ISIP = 2259psi 5 min ISIP = 2061psi.
15:30 Bleed off thg. rig out Halliburton.
RIH and tag bottom @ 6223kb, POOH 124’ bottom packer rubber @ 6099'kb top rubber @ 6074'kb, perfs @ 6075kb-6098'kb.
16:30 Press test Halliburton surface lines to 4000psi. ( Good Test )
Pump 1930gal 15% break @ 2284psi, injection rate 2940psi @ 2.1bbl/min, ISIP =2327psi 5min ISIP = 2261psi, Opsi casing.
17:00 Bleed off thg press, rig out Halliburton, tbg flowing @ .5 bbl @ 5psi., unset packer, bleed off thg to tank 1o surface.
18:45 Rig in to rev circ with 110bbls clay inhibited fresh water to tank #2 with acid. ﬁ E E , VE D
Pump @ 3 bbls/min with 300psi pump pressure, well stable.
POOH 32.00' to bring bottom packer into cased hole, bottom packer rubber @ 6067'kb. = JUL 03
19:30 Secure well SDFN. : 2008
DIS .W
FLUID SUMMARY ( BBLS) Tank # 1 Tank # 2 DAILY COST ANALYSIS' .
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE 370 SERVICE AMOUNT
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE Decca Consulting $ 1,500.00
FLUIDS IN TANKS 54 165 Key Energy Rig 0077 $ 6,330.00
TOTAL LOAD FLUID 372 Ebberts Construction ( Sump pump ) $ 20.00
|RECOVERY LAST 24 HRS. Key Rentals (BOP) $ 360.00
ICUMULATIVE RECOVERY Halliburton $ 24,644.59

(- ) Load fluld: ( +) for new fluid.

GAS PRODUCED LAST 24 HRS

CUMULATIVE GAS PRODUCED

GAS FLARED LAST 24 HRS

CUMULATIVE GAS FLARED ( hrs)

DAILY TOTAL - ) 18 32,854.59
Daily Accum JPREVIOUS TOTAL $ 163,996.18
Rig Hours: 12.5 81.5 CUMULATIVE TOTAL $ 196,850.77

SUPERVISOR: Rick Thomson AFE TOTAL




DECCA CONSULTING

500 - 5th Avenue SW 2010 Calgary, Alberta T2P 2T8

403-263-3373 Office
403-263-3374 Fax

07:15
07:30
07:45
10:00
10:30

12:00
13:00
13:40

14:45
16:30

Hold Pre-job Safety Meeting with all personal on Location.

Check well head pressure 220psiThg, 200psi Csg, bleed off gas head well stable.
POOH 187jts and Halliburton Pin Point Injector Packer w/ 25" spacing, complete with standing valve and bypass.

L/d Halliburton tools.

WELL NAME Devil Mesa 1-13 DATE June 24-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID SE/4-NW/4 SEC13 T36S-R23E DAY NO. 10
PROJECT COMPLETION AFE # 8041732
FORMATION (s) Upper Ismay |Upper Ismay ‘Honecker Trail TD 6222'kb
PERFORATION (s) 6242'- 6251'- 6232-6238' 16210'-6219"- 6182'6187°  :6075'6098" PBTD 6529'kb
June 25-08 | 07:00 hrs. |Test Well with Tomahawk Testers Rig & Num Key 0077
|License H2S Oppm
Lease & road condition  |Good, Dry and Dusty Temp 90F
DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS
07:00 Service and Start Rig.

RIH tbg collar, 1jt 2 3/8" 4.70lb/ft J-55 EUE tbg, 1.875" XN nipple and 190jts 4.70Ib/ft J-55 EUE tbg, ( 191jts in hole total )

Thg bottom @ 6215m

Rig out work floor and power tongs.
N/d BOP, N/u well head.

Tie Tomahawk testers on to well head.
Rig up to swab into testers.

Pull 5 swabs fuild level surface to 1100’ recover. 27bbls water.
Well slugging water on 1.69" choke @ 1-4psi.

Well dead.

Pull 4 swabs fluid level 1900' -2400' recover 15bblis.
Flowed well 1.5hrs and pulled a total of 9 swabs.

Total Load fluid recovered 48bbls.
Csg press = 0 -32psi.

18:00 Turn well over to Tomahawk testers to vent for night on 1.69" line to tank.
NOTE : San Juan County Tax Assessor ( Howard L Randell ) was on location.
NOTE : Ship 180bbls of spent acid to key Energy disposal well.
RECEIVED
JUL 03 2008
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MININ
FLUID SUMMARY ( BBLS) Tank # 1 Tank # 2 DAILY COST ANALYSIS
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE 490 SERVICE AMOUNT
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE Decca Consulting $ 1,500.00
FLUIDS IN TANKS 174 Key Energy Rig 0077 $ 5,673.43
TOTAL LOAD FLUID 214 Ebberts Construction ( Sump pump ) $ 20.00
|RECOVERY LAST 24 HRS. 48 Key Rentals ( BOP) $ 360.00
CUMULATIVE RECOVERY 48 Halliburton ( Packer and servies ) $ 18,842.44
|(-) Load fluid: (+) for new fluid. Tomahawk ( Testers June 23-08 ) $ 5,324.10
GAS PRODUCED LAST 24 HRS Tomahawk ( Testers June 24-08 ) $ 4,072.00
CUMULATIVE GAS PRODUCED
GAS FLARED LAST 24 HRS
CUMULATIVE GAS FLARED ( hrs)
DAILY TOTAL $ 35,791.97
Daily Accum _|PREVIOUS TOTAL $ 196,850.77
Rig Hours: 11 92.5 CUMULATIVE TOTAL $ 232,642.74
SUPERVISOR: Rick Thomson AFE TOTAL




DECCA CONSULTING 4032633373 Offce
500 - 5th Avenue SW 2010 Calgary, Alberta T2P 278 403-263-3374 Fax
WELL NAME Devil Mesa 1-13 DATE June 25-2008
UNIQUE WELL iD SE/4-NW/4 SEC13 T36S-R23E DAY NO. 11
PROJECT COMPLETION AFE # 8041732
FORMATION (s) Upper Ismay |Upper Ismay ‘Honecker Trail TD 6222'kb
PERFORATION (s) 6242'- 6251'- 6232'-6238' 16210-6219'- 6182'6187'  16075'6098' PBTD 6529'kb
June 26-08 | 07:00 hrs. |Test Well with Tomahawk Testers Rig & Num Key 0077

|License H2S Oppm

Lease & road condition [Good, Dry and Dusty Temp 90F

DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS

07:00 Service and Start Rig.

07:15 Hold Pre-job Safety Meeting with all personal on Location.

07:30 Check well head pressure Tstm Tbg, 290psi Csg.

Rig in swab equipment.

Initial fluid level 1500 - 5500', Pull from 2500'- 6000' XN Nipple @ 6182%b.
Pull 16 swabs and flow well a total of 3.5hrs.

Recover 89.26 bbls fresh water, 4.52bbls Oil, 0.01mmscf Gas.

Total fluid to recover = 262bbls.

Total fluid recovered = 137.19bbls.

Fluid to recover =124.81bbls.

Csg pressure 290psi - 470psi

18:00 Close well in for pressure build up, read and record pressures every hr.

08:00

RECEIVED
© JUL 03 208

DAILY cémm_w_lumﬁ

FLUID SUMMARY ( BBLS) Tank #1 Tank # 2

TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE 490 ISERVICE AMOUNT
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE Decca Consulting $ 1,500.00
|FLUIDS IN TANKS 174 47 Key Energy Rig 0077 $ 5,497.01
TOTAL LOAD FLUID 262 Ebberts Construction ( Sump pump ) $ 20.00
|RECOVERY LAST 24 HRS. 89.26 Key Rentals ( BOP ) $ 360.00
CUMULATIVE RECOVERY 137.19 Tomahawk ( Testers June 24-08 ) $ 4,072.00
I(-) Load fluid: ( +) for new fluid. -124.81 Halliburton $ 2,211.53
GAS PRODUCED LAST 24 HRS 0.01mmscf Key Energy Trucking ( Acid Hauling ) $ 989.28
CUMULATIVE GAS PRODUCED Key Energy Trucking ( Acid Hauling ) $ 989.28
GAS FLARED LAST 24 HRS Key Energy  ( Disposal cost ) $ 76.00
CUMULATIVE GAS FLARED ( hrs) Key Energy ( Disposal cost ) $ 76.00
Ebberts Construction ( May 23 -31 ) $ 9,265.17
Ebberts Construction ( June 1-2 ) $ 6,172.76
DAILY TOTAL $ 31,229.03
Daily Accum JPREVIOUS TOTAL $ 196,850.77
Rig Hours: 11 103.5 |CUMULATIVE TOTAL $ 228,079.80

SUPERVISOR: Rick Thomson AFE TOTAL




DECCA CONSULTING

500 - 5th Avenue SW 2010 Calgary, Alberta T2P 2T8

CONFIDENTIAL

403-263-3373 Office
403-263-3374 Fax

WELL NAME Devil Mesa 1-13 DATE June 26-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID SE/4-NW/4 SEC13 T36S-R23E DAY NO. 12
PROJECT COMPLETION AFE # 8041732
FORMATION (s) Upper Ismay IUpper Ismay ‘Honecker Trail D 6222'kb
PERFORATION (s) 6242- 6251'- 6232'-6238' 16210'-6219"- 6182'6187'  16075'6098" PBTD 6529'kb
June 27-08 | 07:00 hrs. |Test Well with Tomahawk Testers Rig & Num Key 0077
JLicense H2S Oppm

Lease & road condition |Good, Dry and Dusty Temp 90F

DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS

07:00 Service and Start Rig.
07:15 Hold Pre-job Safety Meeting with all personal on Location.
07:30 Check well head pressure 134psi, Thg, 499psi, Csg
Bleed off tbg on 1.69" line.
Rig in swab equipment.
08:00
Pull 14 swabs and flow well Thr 40mins.
Recover 16.91 bbls fresh water, 4.98bbls Oil, 0.22mmcf Gas.
Salinity, 200,000 - 210.000ppm
Total fluid to recover = 262bbls.
Total fluid recovered = 154.10bbls.
Fluid to recover =107.90bbls.
Csg pressure 290psi - 470psi
A.P.L. =41.4 @ 60deg.

Initial fluid fevel 5000" - 6000°, Pull from 6000 XN Nipple @ 6182'kb.

18:00 Close well in for pressure build up, read and record pressures every hr.

Note: Field Measurements for June 26-2008 will be E-mailed @ 07:00 hr June 27-2008.

RECEIVED

JUL 03 2008

DIV.OFOIL, G ‘
FLUID SUMMARY ( BBLS) — Tank#1 | Tank#2 DAILY COST ANALYSIS
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE 490 ISERVICE AMOUNT
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE Decca Consulting $ 1,500.00
FLUIDS IN TANKS 174 132 Key Energy Rig 0077 $ 5,497.01
TOTAL LOAD FLUID 262 Ebberts Construction ( Sump pump ) $ 20.00
RECOVERY LAST 24 HRS. 16.91 Key Rentals (BOP) $ 360.00
CUMULATIVE RECOVERY 154.1 Tomahawk $ 4,072.00
(-) Load fluid:  ( +) for new fluid. (+107.90)
GAS PRODUCED LAST 24 HRS 0.22mmcf
CUMULATIVE GAS PRODUCED
GAS FLARED LAST 24 HRS
CUMULATIVE GAS FLARED ( hrs)
DAILY TOTAL $ 11,449.01
Daily Accum JPREVIOUS TOTAL $ 263,871.77
Rig Hours: 10 113.5 |CUMULATIVE TOTAL $ 275,320.78
SUPERVISOR: Rick Thomson AFE TOTAL
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And 10bbls of oil = 180bbls total.
- RECEIVED

WELL NAME Devil Mesa 1-13 DATE June 27-2008
UNIQUE WELL 1D SE/4-NW/4 SEC13 T36S-R23E DAY NO. 13
PROJECT COMPLETION AFE # 8041732
FORMATION (s) Upper Ismay |Upper Ismay 1Honecker Trail TD 6222'kb
PERFORATION (s) 6242'- 6251'- 6232'-6238' 16210-6219'- 6182'6187'  16075'6098' PBTD 6529'kb
dJune 28-08 | 07:00 hrs. |RIH to Circ_onto Bridge Plug, POOH, RiH with Wireline Bridge Plug Rig & Num Key 0077
luicense Pressure test, Dump Bail Cement,RIH with Wireline Bridge Plug. H2S Oppm
Lease & road condition |Good, Dry and Dusty Temp 90F
DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS
07:00 Service and Start Rig.
07:15 Hold Pre-job Safety Meeting with all personal on Location.
07:30 Check well head pressure 2psi, Tbg, 400psi, Csg
Bleed off tbg on 1.69" line.
Rig in swab equipment.
08:00 Initial fluid level 5500' - 6000, Pull from 6000" XN Nipple @ 6182'kb.
Pull 8 swabs and flow well 10mins.
Recover 10.49 bbls water, 1.14bbls Oil, 0.01mmscf Gas.
Salinity, 240,000 - 210.000ppm
Total fluid to recover = 262bbls.
Total fluid recovered = 164.59bbls.
Fluid to recover = 97.41bbils.
APl =41.4 @ 60deg.
Two water samples and two oil samples taken to lab in Grand Junction, by Tomahawk Testing.
12:00 Bleed off Csg pressure of 192psi to testers.
12:30 Rig out testers.
Pump 25bbls clay inhibited fresh water down Tbg.
13:00 N/d welihead, N/u BOP.
Rig in work floor and power tongs.
13:45 POOH 95stds 2 3/8" J-55 EUE thg 1 x 1.875 XN nipple and 1 single, 2 3/8" tbg.
16:30 Wait on Halliburton Pkr hand.
Mix 130bbls fresh water with 25 gals Halliburton ANHIB #2 corrosion inhibitor.
17:30 M/u Retrieving tool to retrieve Bridge plug @ 6226'kb, RIH 35stds to a depth of 2282.69'kb.
18:00 Secure well SDFN.
Note: Ship 170bbls of spent acid water to key Energy disposal well.

JUL 03 2008

DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING Jl

FLUID SUMMARY ( BBLS) Tank # 1 Tank # 2 DAILY COST ANALYSIS
TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE 620 SERVICE AMOUNT
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE Decca Consulting $ 1,500.00
JFLUIDS IN TANKS 130 Key Energy Rig 0077 $ 5,933.43
TOTAL LOAD FLUID 262 Ebberts Construction ( Sump pump ) $ 20.00
RECOVERY LAST 24 HRS. 10.49 Key Rentals ( BOP) $ 360.00
CUMULATIVE RECOVERY 164.59 Tomahawk $ 6,974.10
1(-) Load fluid:  ( +) for new fluid. -97.41
GAS PRODUCED LAST 24 HRS 0.01mmct
CUMULATIVE GAS PRODUCED
GAS FLARED LAST 24 HRS
CUMULATIVE GAS FLARED ( hrs)
DAILY TOTAL $ 14,787.53
Daily Accum JPREVIOUS TOTAL $ 274,948.85
Rig Hours: 11 124.5 _|CUMULATIVE TOTAL $ 289,736.38
SUPERVISOR: Rick Thomson AFE TOTAL




D ECCA Co N S U LTI N G 403-263-3373 Office
500 - 5th Avenue SW 2010 Calgary, Alberta T2P 2T8 403-263-3374 Fax
WELL NAME Devil Mesa 1-13 DATE June 28-2008
UNIQUE WELL ID SE/4-NW/4 SEC13 T36S-R23E DAY NO. 14
PROJECT COMPLETION AFE # 8041732
FORMATION (s) Upper Ismay [Upper Ismay :Honecker Trail TD 6222'kb
PERFORATION (s) 6242'- 6251'- 6232'-6238' :6210'-6219'- 6182'6187°  :6075'6098' PBTD 6529'kb

June 29-08 | 07:00 hrs. |Dump Bail 50' cement on BP @ 6060'kb, RIH 94stds 2 3/8" thg in hole and Rig & Num Key 0077

JLicense lay down on trailor, N/d BOP N/d 7 1/16" x 11" T/h, cement F/50' to Surface. |H2S Oppm

Lease & road condition - {Good, Dry and Dusty Temp 90F

DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS

07:00 Service and Start Rig.
07:15 Hold Pre-job Safety Meeting with all personal on Location.
07:30 Check well head pressure, SITP, 100psi, SICP = 180psi
Bleed off gas head to rig tank. well dead.
08:00 Cont to RIH with 2 3/8" 4.7Ib/ft J-55 EUE tbg and retrieving tool from 2282'kb.
09:30 Install Washington head.
Tag top of Chicken Grit @ 6238kb ( Tbg tally ) 6222'kb ( Wireline depth )
10:00 Rev Circ with 130 bbls fresh water with Halliburton ANHIB #2 corrosion inhibitor. ( Well Taken fluid well breaking Circ )
Latch on to WRP bridge plug @ 6242%kb ( Tbg tally }
12:00 POOH and L/d 3 singles 2 3/8" tbg.
POOH 94stds + 1 single, break out and L/d Halliburton retrieving tool and B.P.
14:30 N/d Washington head.
15:00 Rig in Pure Energy Wireline.
Setting of Cast Iron Bridge Plugs and press test, plus Dump bailing of Cement was Witnessed By Jeff S. Brown
Bureau of Land Management Monticello, Utah.
Set # 1 Cast iron bridge @ 6150'kb.
Dump bail 50" Glass G cement on top of Bridge plug.
RIH with # 2 Cast Iron Bridge plug set @ 6060'kb.
20:30 Fill Hole 6bbls fresh water with Halliburton ANHIB #2 corrosion inhibitor.
Press test Cast Iron Bridge plug set @ 6060'kb to 100psi low ( 15mins Good Test ) 1000psi High ( 15 mins Good Test )
Bleed off press to rig tank.
21:00 Secure Well SDFN.

RECEIVED
JUL 03 2908

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MININ

FLUID SUMMARY ( BBLS) Tank # 1 Tank # 2 DAILY COST ANALYSIS

TOTAL FLUID HAULED TO LEASE 620 SERVICE AMOUNT
TOTAL FLUID HAULED FROM LEASE Decca Consulting $ 1,500.00
|FLUIDS IN TANKS Key Energy Rig 0077 $ 7,027.30
TOTAL LOAD FLUID Ebberts Construction ( Sump pump ) $ 20.00
JRECOVERY LAST 24 HRS. Key Rentals ( BOP ) $ 360.00
CUMULATIVE RECOVERY Halliburion ( BPS + tool hand ) $ 8,756.38
(-) Load fluld: _ ( +) for new fluid. Pure Energy { Wireline ) $ 15,134.93
GAS PRODUCED LAST 24 HRS

CUMULATIVE GAS PRODUCED

GAS FLARED LAST 24 HRS

CUMULATIVE GAS FLARED ( hrs)

DAILY TOTAL ’ $ 32,798.61
Daily Accum __|PREVIOUS TOTAL $ 289,736.38
Rig Hours: 14 138.5 [CUMULATIVE TOTAL $ 322,534.99

SUPERVISOR: Rick Thomson AFE TOTAL




STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM@

5. LEASE D'ESIGN‘ATIOI;J AND'SE_RIAL NUMBER‘

UTU 076834

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS _

Do ot use'this formn tor proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing weils below current-bottom-hole depth, regnter plugged wells, orto
anlf nerizontal laterals. Use APPL!CATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals, )

B I INDIAN. ALLOTTEE OR TRIGE NAME-

———

"7, UNIT or GA AGREEMENT NAME;

Dev_il Mesa Unit UTU-085840X

8, WELL NAME and NUMBER'

1 TYPE OF WELL :
o o WELL J GAS WEL.L l:l‘ OTHER _Abanqoneq _ Devil Mesa Unit 1- 13
"%, NAME OF OPERATOR; i ' B RETNUNBER
Baytex Energy USA Ltd o , 4303731879
TS ADORESS OF OPERATOR. ' ’ TFHONE NUMBER | 10, FIELD AND POOL. OR WILDCAT.
_B0D-17th St. Suite 19008 . Denver arare ©O 80202 1(303) 825-2777 Undesignated

4. LOGATION OF WELL

fooTAtEs AT SURFACE: 1522' FNL 2419 FWL SE/M4 NW/4

counry: San Juan

QYRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: :f’sg,;i; padig HECVE T3 R2RE STATE: uTAH
‘ 1‘.1‘: CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE TURE OF NOTICE REPORT OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYF_’E OF ACTION
[j NOTICE OF ITENT ﬁ AchIZE E] DEEPEN E] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
{Submit in Duplicete) [ aurercasme [ rracture TREAT [7] swetrack roRepaR WeL
Approximate-date work will stert [:] LABING REPAR [} newconstrusTion [T} remPorariLy ABaNDON
[] GHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [[] oreratorchanse [ tusne repar
[] CHANGE TUBING BLUG AND ABANDON ] venr OR FLARE
O S%gf&%%ﬁg;ﬂmogn& ] crance wewl nave 7] ruuesack E] WATER DISPOSAL
ate f work completon ’ ]:] CHANGE WELL STATUS [} eropucTioN STARTRESUME) E] WATER SHUT-OFF
[ commnaLe PRODUCING FORMATIONS  [] REGLAMATION OF WELL SITE [ ermer
6’30/2008 E] CONVERT WELL TYPE [[] recompLeTe ; DIFFERENT FORMATION '

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details inciuding dates, depths, volumes, ete.
6/28/2008: Rev Cir¢ with 130 bbls fresh water with Halliburton ANHIB #2 corrosion inhibitor.

Setting of Cast Iron Bridge Plugs and press test, plus Dump bailing of Cement was Witnessed By Jeff S. Brown

Bureau of Land Management Monticello, Utah.

# 1 Cast iron bridge @ 6150'kb.

Dump bail 50" Glass G cement on top of Bridge plug.

# 2 Cast Iron Bridge plug set @ 6060'kb.

Fill Hole 6bbis fresh water with Halliburton ANHIB #2 corrosion inhibitor,

Press test Cast Iron Bridge plug set @ 6060kb to 100psi low { 15mins Good Test ) 1000psi High { 15 mins Good Test )

6/29/2008: RIH with Pure Energy Dump Bailer and dump 50" of Class G cement on top of Cast iron bridge plug @ 6080°kb.

Cement 4.5" Csg from 50' to surface with Class G cement

6/30/2008: Dug out &' around well head area.

Cut off 6'- 8 3/8" csg + 6'- 4 1/2" csg.

Remove csg bowl. Cap 4 1/2" ¢sg.

Cap 8 5/8" csg and identify well on top of 8 5/8" cap.
Job Compiete. Well abandoned. Date: June 30, 2008

David Friesen

Manager, Drilling and Completions

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) TITLE
SIGNATURE {/" ’;\tj;”w *‘"‘w- - e . _  DATE 7 4[-2008
(This space for State use only)A RECE%\{ Eﬁ o
JUL 7 2 2008
(2000 (50 nametans o Rvers S O, GF (i, GAS & MINING




Well Name: Devil Mesa Unit 1-13
APl # 4303731879
Location: - 1522' FNL 2419’ FWL SE/4 NW/4 Sec 13 T36S R23E

Abandonment Summary

6/28/2008 Rev Circ with 130 bbls fresh water with Halliburton ANHIB #2 corrosion inhibitor.
Setting of Cast iron Bridge Plugs and press test, plus Dump bailing of Cement was Witnessed By Jeff S. Brown
Bureau of Land Management Monticello, Utah. ‘
# 1 Cast-iron bridge @ 6150kb,
Dump bail 50" Glass G.cement on:top of Bridge plug.
# 2 Cast lron  Bridge plug set @ 6080'kb.
Fili Hole 6bbls fresh water with Halliburton ANHIB #2-corrosion inhibitor.
Press test Cast iron Bridge plug.set @ 6060'kb to 100psi low { 15mins Good Test ) 1000psi High ( 15 mins Good Test )

6/29/2008 RiH with Pure Energy Dump Bailer and dump 50" of Class G cement.on-top of Cast iron bridge plug @ 6060'kb. -
Cement 4.5" Csg from-50' o surface with Class G cement

6/30/2008 Dug out 6" -around well head area.
Cut off 6'- 8 3/8" csg + 6- 4 1/2" csg.
Remove csg bowl:

Cap4.1/2" csg.

Cap 8 5/8" csg and identify well -on top of 8 5/8" cap. R?? gElVED
Location Clean. :
Job Complete: Well abandoned. Date: dune 30, 2008 Ji 5 2008

L Ur Ui, GAS & MINING
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HECEIVED
JUL 7 5 7008

OIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING —

SRR )

- e T o § Gl “TGperator
Complete Well Summary 144.037-31879-0000 Baytex Enorgy USA Lid,
X . ‘Qriginal KB Blevation (i} KB—G‘rround Distange (ty |[Spud Date Rig Relsase Date
DEVIL. MESA UNIT 1-13 6.130.00 200 51972008 513072008
iSurface Legat Location Latitde (OMS) ;
1522 FNL, 2419FWL SEM NEM _0PgoN :
Wl Config: Deviated - Ofigipal Hole, 7/4/2008 112707 AM. . "] Origin i s B
T ‘Wellbore APHLIWI Bim: Loc. Profile Type KO WD (ricdy VS B Y
e SChEmatie - ACYeRE ) Depith lu:amets 43,037.3}579.@000 oo P vee e, s oy | iFectional
prCaS PP o dead Davistion Survey Devialion Survey
N e Ets Dir. survey for Qriginal Hole
" Seciion. | “Szelin) Acl Top (RKB) Faf B hkg)
Conducior : 72 o 7048
-4 Surface 11l 7o 21780
Production . 7718 2,178.0 65900
ol o | o0 ek et
PBTDSs [P R i
500 0 |02 Date T Dotk (RKB] | Methiod ] ... Comment
SR . Lo ]
0 03 .
Formations o -
2471 0 110 Final Top M Final Top TVQ
’ Formation Veme| Gdologic Age | Efement Type H3S (%) ( 1. ey
‘ Upper tsmay 59285
1311665 20 Honeiar Trai
B 1678 20 Deviation Surveys -
Late Gy ! Pop? 4. Defntve?
(3719981 20 EAtzeos  [EisDir sufvey for Ofiginal Hole } No { No
| Conductor, T0.0RKB - s
Linlg 005 20 . [Run Date  [Centralizers Seratchers Drift M.
i93./5,708] 60 ; “flom Description | Bt RKE) T Jis T 1D (in) .. WA(kigs] | Grade | Top Thieas
i 3 - . 1ajCasing Joints 75 01 1] = T -
AIET13] B8 | - Surface; 2,178.08KB .
! i |RunDale  [Gentralizers T§cratehars
Q815,727 858 i o 5122008 [16 Bowspring - Mig point on #1, collars I
i #2543, then pvgry 130!( tt_a surfaca i o
o5 781] 49 1 | e Déscription | Bt (i8] | s T LA diips)
. 1Easing Joints PREZE T 513 1
N Pt N Bridge Plug \Float Callar 243810 4 ,
Parmanent, - ga;;gg Joints g:z;g :} 1.0))-58 é;gc
L08!15,836 | 4.3 e uideshoe 178 18
' £.060-5,065 = Production, 6,590.08KE .
o7:[5848] 41 v |RunDate  ICentralizers iScraichers Drft M.
E ] L i 5[2912008 65 4 1/2" Bowspring - Joinits #1412 then |
1071 5,8491 4.0 ! e | Pm“mmgb I E suvggéﬁ 10 3600 and svery 100" to
] - 6,078:6,098, B S Ao
L0%115,869| 3.6 il 8/222008 NDDJ’"’ ... em Description ) | Grade | Top Thesad
’ ' ' 4 1i21Casing Joints 6851088 LT&C
4 112|Marker Joint 0.3J-58 LT&C
HIOUBETY| 38 4 112/ Casing Joints 6.8\4-55 LTac
. Bridge fy[ug 4 1{2{Float Gollar. 8RD
| 1515.920| 26 4 12| Casing Joints 0.5(4-55 LT&C
g Permanem - 4 -112]Fioat Shoe B8RD
85928 2 6.1506.154 |Gonductor Coment, casing, Saizios 00:00
Cameanting Campany iEvaluation Method ICament Evalualion Results
1850 5.929( 2.8 ] !
‘ SigNo.  IDescription Top (AKB) [Bim (KB}  [Full Return?
+18,15.953 2.0 Perforated, R iCondsictar Cament, Q.0 70.0
g’ggzgo‘:? | O Amount| Vel | Mix HPG Fglio i
A8lo958] 19 } Fuid | Class | [sacks} | - (R¥sack) (gslsack) | v (bbi) Fluid Deg
| | ¢ . I
1 o~ I~ — N
721(5.981] 14 Perforated, i Surd Casing 3 !“_9 5 2003 00 15 o
o 5’2;?2&2819* : i [Eémenting Company Evahuauon ethod © T lGement Bvaluation Fesulls
2115980 12 612 ; © Hatibunten Energy Services Returns 16 Surface Full rewsrns through out cement jois, S0bbls of
i ' gond cement to surface,
L2E15.002| 08 Perforated; . |GtgNe |Desgription Top (KB [Bim (KB] [Pl Retuen?’
- 6:232-8,238, I 4 iSurfage Gasing Cement L 90 21780 Yes
123150081 08 G7IZ008 : Amount Yigeet Mi):_l‘iZD Ratia
| _Fuig | Class |fsasks) | (RYsack) (galfsack) | v enbi)| Fluid Des
12418013 07 | | Perforated, |Preflush i H20°
’ 6,242:6,351, ' ;- lLead 500 283 17.83| 236.5|SanJaun PRB A with 0. 1261m
.35 [8.022] 07 l €/1712008 k ‘ pofyfiake
i Disg H20
2916,062] 6.7 ' |Production Casing.Cement, casin ng, 5/29/2008 11:00 g
[ [€ementing & ompary Evalugtion tethed ‘Cement Evaluation Resulls
aal61sal 07 | d Halfiburten Energy Retums 1o Surface .
| $lgNo.  |Description iTop (AKB)  |Bim (AKB)  |Ful Retum?
Jaels s8] 0.7 [ 1 iProduction Casing Gement _ i f_ oo | esw0 _Yes
' Arrou e myelcfk) M:_;r 1-/50 Re;na : !
. ! Flugt | Ciass | H 'S80} galisack) | v (b | Fluid Des: i
40i6,178| 0.7 | ' Brefiush ] ’ 30/H20 T ’
| & Mud Flusk : 3.0 Mud
saase) 07 | : Lsad 16 820, 310,0/Siandard G + 3% Econaiite +
: H ;D 26% Polyftake + 10tisk
588.350{ 0.7 »’_ : i iGalsom!e
4 K Tail 282 80.0POZ 50/50 +0.2% Halad-R +
-59i[6,360{ 0.7 : P 10.1251brsk Palyfiake « 0.3% D-AIR
[+ 0.2% CFR.3
data Tast updated on 7/4/2008 527 P gmt Sspiece.. e 101020
printed on Friday, July 04, 2008 E:rzgg :om &n e )f'EE.!all{'ga"ﬁgI 0:90 [Cement Evaluation Resufts
www.peloton.com page 113 G bomesny e j




RECEIVED
JUL 23 2008

T$ig No. Sescnption - “Top (HIKB)  |Btm (RK2)  [Full Retum?!
Complete Well Summary DIV i }Cemant Pluy , | 51000 | 1500 !
OF O“.. GAS&MINING ) Amaunt’, " Yield ™ T Mix 20 Rabo T mmm——
DEVIL MESA UNIT 1-13 Fuid | Clags | (sacks) | (Mvssciy, | (gofsack] | v.(ohy) | _ FlugDes
Tail i6 . o
|Cement Plug, plug, 6/29/2008 00:00
NN VCemen Eompany Evaluation Method ICement Evaluanon Results
| Depth Markers: [§ig Ne. ™ [Dscription Top (IKB) |Biim (KB  [Full Return!
[rCos.seeiny Cerpent Plug o . o | so0 ]
T Amounf| " Vield T Mix H20 Ratior |

; Fluid | Cless | (sacks) | (HYsack) . (oavsack) | v (bwl | FluidDes ...
N [Tail G e ‘

; Dump Bail Cement (507, pleg, 6 00 R
ol ¢ |00 Cemaring Company “Evaibation Metrod Cement Evaluation Results

!
0z Sigho  |Description [Top (#KB) [Bim (HKB) |Full Retum?
S0y 0102 |Durmp Bai Coment (50) | sotop | soe00 |
T AmGunt Yieid Wi 20 Ratio't . )
70| 0 |03 Fiyid Glass | (sacks).| (A¥sack) (ggu‘/sack} 1 gol) Fluid Des
2| o |10 T T e §
) Other In Hole ‘ N
A11,868] 20 00 i} "Dascigion | 1o (RKBT Blm (RKB] TG n) | Meke T thodel
4'1/2{Bridge Plug - Permanent toB, 08T 0 8 065,07 i
L7820 . A 1i2;Bridge Plug-Permanent.. | 871500 g1ss0l | ]
C rmeron $22, <Make?>.on 5/13/2008 o . »
2,17 1.995] 2.0 install Date Type Make WP (psi) ].Siza‘(in) Last Quarhau,
5!13!2008 Carmeran €22 . |
172005 2.0 3: Wellhead Components " e S
! Top. Btmi WP
1935.705 8,0 | Make | Model |S.1 TopGénn |S2(in) Szt Description l (psi)
CAMER TC22 CASINGBOWL T
a6 713 58
T General Notes. - e
Date iType 1 iType 2 Cornment.
19808.727| 58 | 613012008 . ; Well was.clat and capped.
] | Dritling - onginal "E/712008 06:00°
N X 4. L LEENND i e gt s
011881 49 lj ) Job Category Primary Job Type Start Date *  |End Dote
o6 5.831] 4.4 Bridge Plug Diilling rDrlllmg onginal S§/7/2008 | 6/30/2008 Cap«ta‘xze
PR ' Permanent Target Formation Tot Depth (... [AFE Number tTolal AFE Totai Cost Final inv. Cost
: e Upper ismay 6,581.0 07031788 | 989.973.00 | 1:279,640.00
\061[5,836] 4.3 5 0808 068 Summary :
P SO B | Waell is drilted &nd cased, . o
- . | Job Contacts . .
07| 5,849) 4.0 Porforated, | ¢ | Contact Name | ....Company . 08 | Mobite
= 6.076-3,098. I . }
0%5.869| 38 t 612212008 Terry Blacquler {Bayvtex Energy USA Weéllsite
e ) Suipervisior
LADOSBT) 38 ; ELARESUIER BAYTEX ENERGY USA LTD Dritling Foreman
[ 149, ) ARARAALSAAASS, . -
55920 26 LT JEFFERYL  [PATTERSON-UTIDRILLING [Rig Manager
I | Parmanant, - - PETERS COMPANY
15i5025! 28 412 ‘ MARSHALL B |PATTERSON-UTI DRILLING Rig Manager
RSt g 6,15045,155 GALLEGOS 'COMP N' . N o
sisezel 25 | | | BHA #1, Drilling Assombly S IS
[ : BHA No “Siza in) adel HADLC Codes JIAQG Bt Dulf
18 ; . . ) IFOS 1218 5-E-WT-AeE- .
W858 20| | T4  Sedoraind, I et n (K8) Depth Out (K@) [oniea) (o Tene . B s Out.. 1ADG Bit Dul
15058l 10 | 3 14 82202008 : 720 0.0 A08.00 800 8O0 [SEWTAEIWE.
LR ) i String Compenants
Srhith FDS, Bit Sub,. Drill Colar
215981 1.4 g ; Perforatad, li.; = i - ]
4 - 6,210:6,219, - et i

\ p R 8 B/22/2008 JADE. Codas WO B DO ™
\21|5.990] 1.2 ! / T2 | “ j’ B —- {23:CC.0ue:

! i [Depth in (RKB Depth eu f‘tKB) |Drilled ) Brill Time {... | Bit Hes Out. JIADE 8it Duil
«236.002) 0.9 g Perforated, 480.0 I 24788 | 169800 2950 2950  |2-3-CC-0-HWE
. LR w_zlﬁfzdgazs% * | String Components
i2%/6.008; 08 g TRENDON PDC. MOTOR, X.0.. D.C., Drill pipe - Stands, Dril pipe - Singles

. ! . L |BH Drilling Assembly - N e
+241,6.013| 07 Partorated, ; BHA Ne Size () WModel ’ TADE Eotes ‘mnc Broar -

‘ 3 4 e s e |ubsty . —
25:8.022) 07 : _Depth in (RKB)  Depth Out (RKB)  [Drillea (1) Dril Time (-, | Bit Hrs Out... mc Bit Dl

: 21780 38350 1.657.00 34.00 3400
296,082 0F | | i Siring Components
] | | United UDS13, PDC-BIT, MOTOR, UBHO SUB, MONEL, HW.D.F.. Drill pipe - Stands
98:6.154| 07 l : [BHA #4, Drilling Assembl e e
| BHANG  Sweum "Made [1ADE Codes IADC 84 Dutt
316158 07 || A TR ‘u0513 1 e s
Depth In (AIKBY Dapth Out (KB} | Drited (it Deiti Time{. |Bit-Hrs Out. ADC 8#t Dutl
IAGHE TS D7 | 3.863.0 83120 2,449.00 65.50 6550 | e
I String Componants
LS4il6318] 0.7 |/ United Diamond UD513, 2 7@ P.D C, MOTOR WIT:8 RATE, UBHO SUB. MONEL, MONEL, HW.D'P,
| KELLY, Drill pigis - Stands. Drif pip
isalease| 07 1’ ; g [BHA #5, Coring sembly
! 3 BYANo  Slze Tin} TRDC Cades JADC Bit Dull
596,360, 07 | 4 K 5 | re43 _}@:2299 , | - e
Dépth In (KB [Dapth Out (1KB) | Drifted (f) Dt Time ¢ |Bit Hrs Out ‘moc Bit Dull
i - A— 83120 6.342.0 30.00 13.50 13.50 e
data last updated on 7/4/2008 5:27 PM gmt 'siring Components :
printed on Friday, July 04, 2008 Dowtdce C2259, Bit Sub, Core Barrel, XO Sub, Jars, HWDP
www.peloton.com page 2/3




RECEIVED
JUL 25 2008

Complete Well Summary  0jy, OF OIL GAS & MINING
DEVIL MESA UNIT 1-13

8 78 UDS3
Dapth in (RKE) §Deplh Gt (#KB)

8, 342 @ { 6,384.0
Slring Gomponems

Diillea (ft)
. 42.00

1ACG Codes
X8
Drlu Time (..,

2.00 67.50

United Diamond UD513, Moter, HWDP. Jars. HWDP

[l}‘&ﬁé'éit' [shTT}

Bit Hrs Ot

‘ }i‘m‘c Bit Do

i - Onginat Hole, 7472008 11:27.07 AW
B :
A%

i -
(D DLsy
g OLE |

e85

|_Depth Markers
FICHS SPAP gy

<7

D)

02

0.3

| 1.0

1,668 20

1,675 2.0

"11.995| -

Siring Components

BHA #7 , Drifling Assemh _1

IBHA R0 1Size i) odel
7 L T Poc-stz
Bepth in {KB) - |Depin Dut (RKE)
64120 } 6:590.0

Diilied {#)
178.00

’IADC Codes

Drilt Time (.., !Byt His Out.,
450 | 430

Unnad Diamy. PDC- 513 PRC-BIT, MOTOR W8 RATE. HW.LD P, Drill pipe « Stands

lmnc B’nb_uu

WDE Codes™”

!orm Time (.

14,00 27.50

B Drilling Assemb} e
BH Size {iny ‘Modei )
8 | 748 Cm ;
Depth i (K} Depm ‘Gt ik} lDriIIed i
84140 30,00
Siring Components
Dowdeo £2299, Bit Sub, CORE BBL, X/O SUB, X/O SUB, JAR, HW.D.P,,
BHA #9, Drilfing Assembly T
BHA No. - [Size (in). Mods!
k) 78 PDC:513 ‘
Depth n {7KB) Depih Out (KB)  {Drilled (1)
§414.0 6,590.0 P 17600
String Components '

{8t Hrs. Out..

IADC 8
|2 0FTHR

 pipe - Stands.

{1ARC Codes”
1Dl Tishe (.., [Bil Hrs Out..
I 480 9.00

Unv!ed Digm. PDC-513 MOTOR Wi7.8 RATE, HWDF‘ darg, HW.D P, Dritt pipe - Stands

TIABC Bit Hufl

1MDC Bit Dyl

2,008

i

193¢ 3,

w
=
8
Il
o
-

B4 5713

9815727

| BHA #10, Drillingj\ssembly

String Components

[BHA No ‘S-ze “n) Mode!
10 Tve  |PDE-513
Depth In{AKB) Depth Qut (KB}

Drilted (f1)

United Diam. PRC-513, PDEBIT, MOTOR WI(7:8 RATE

»01116,781

1,061} 6,831

4.4

Bridge F'Iug

TTADE Codes

i Bﬂ Hrs: Quit. .

Drilt Tirne
i oon

Initial comp_let on, 6/15/2008 00:00

HWOP, Dril pipe - Sands.

NADCEE DU
]1.z.c ~O-X-A-ND
1ADC Bit Dull

1-2-CE-0:X-1:ND=

Permanem

18 .060:6,06

5836 43

0768461 4.1

1,071(5.849 Perforated,
-~ 1 6,078-8,098,

612272008

0% 5,869

» 104 8,871

(o

SABAAALS uw-uwwww‘
ridge Fiu

28 .
: Permanam. o j~
42 Lol

£,150-8,155

+15¢: 5,920

£,928
5,929

5,953 1 Parforated,

~8,1BZ6167,
6/22/2608

5,958

5.881 Perfardted,
- 8108218,

6/22/12008

115,990

123:16.002 Farforated,

« 6,232-6,238,
€/17/2008

236,008

\24:16,013 Perforated,
—6,242-6,251,

1772008

;.~Wwﬂ " Py

(2518022

<
~

120 6.062!

6,154

6,158

4016179

546,318

. 58l 359

y

€,360

Job Category | Primary Job. Type Slar Qate  [EndDate”  [Costiype,
Compiumnm’ovkuvw ilnmal Compleum 6152008 | 6/30/2008 Capitalize
Target Fermation TgtDepth (. |AFE Number [Tma! AFE ~ [Totai Cost Final tnv. Cost
08041732 l
Summary )
Well was. d and abandoned, .
-|Job Contacts

| Contast Nama i -

Campary

BHANG [§izefiny fadei TADC Eodes’ ’tADC i Ol

Depth-in (KB) - }Dap\hom(nks) ’Drmed () ]onu Time (... Bn Hrs Qut... [IADE Bit Dull

String Carmponents

Deviation Surveys

Descrrphon

g ‘op (RKB] Bim. (RKB)|
i l

| No. Tyee Top (g | Btm (#KB} | Recov (f) Weibore
i Ccnvmum\al 638407 T BT Original Hole o
2 Conventional £.387.0 .. 5,408.0| Griginal Hole
DST Data "
Daoth Top | Depih Bim §""
Date o Typs - Zong (RKB) _fKB)
Leak Off and Formation Integrity Tests -
T i | Dans
: L Puid it eak
| Testate | | tostCasing StingRun | P(Suf)(ps) | Deotn(tiks) | (%98 |otr?
) ! No

Schematic Annotations

Depthfire] "

Equipment Problems

Resoed |
Qate

Failure )
Date %-f:aﬂﬁoﬁcﬁe@zw Tyee j, Lost.

Cause | . .[Faileditem

data fast updated on 7/AIZ008 527 PM grit
printed on Friday, July 04, 2008
www, peloton com page 3/3




RECUEIVED
JUL 25 2008

"BAYTEX  DV.OFOIL, GAS & MININdVell Summary

B N A R

Well Name: DEVIL MESA UNIT 113

e " Toudace Toga Toaion T e N ik Ne

44’—037&31‘879-0000 1522 FNL, 2418 FWL SEI4 NE/4 WILDCAT '!44—037-31 879-0000
$pud Date ’ Rig Release Date 7 {waelk Gonfiguration Type ’ . Total Depth (fIKB)
5/8/2008 5/30/2008 Deviated 6,590.0
Grigings KB Elevation ()] Ground Elevation (1} [CF Etev (f) T Eley ¢ty Other Efevation (ft) KB-Ground Distance (ft] [KB-CF () " IKB.TH ()
6,130.00 6,118.00 , } ‘ 12.00
Brifling Gontact ) [Ccrriplétion Contest Reservoir Contact ' " [Bredoction Contact
Dave Friesen ; i
Dirgctions To Welt
From Monticello,Utah :
Hwy Junctlon{ 191 & 491}. South 11 2 mlles on Hwy 191 to 204 road, Lefton 204 road 28 mlles to"Y", Iefk at"Y" 4.4 miles, Left 2.1miles into !ocatnon
T e T T T W ! B
Carmeron c22 ! ! |
BarAtWellbors, T T e ] ) KG Wl kBT
2 Onglnal Hole Directional |
Casing Strings. e e e e
. Gesing Deserplior TN <5 R Grade " 1" SelDeplh [AKB)
Conductor »1'42'
{Surface 5/1 2/2008 i 8 5/8 [ J-58
[Production 5/29/2008 ! A2 J-55
Cement S . e e e o , e am]
‘Gonductor Cement, ¢ casin 5 2008 00 00 e L B
wmewhrg Lcmpany
Top (AKB)  ~ C Idotom ke o {Full-Rgtum? Camant Volumme. Return (bbl)
0.0 o 70.0 ;
Fiuid. iaseription ‘ Fluid Type: o {Amoiud {sacks) Class
] Tail B G ,
‘Surface Casing ( Cement, casing, 5/12/2008 00:15 e ' '
}wmen‘mg Company )
‘Halliburton Energy Services
Top {HK8) Bottom (IKB) Full Retun? Cement Volurre Return (bibly
0.0 2,178.0 Yes 50.0
Fluigd Description Fluid Type Amaurt (5acks) Ciass
H20 Preflush
Fluid Dascription Fidiid Type Amount {sacks) o ' Class
Sandaun PRB l with 0.125lbm Lead 500
polyflake
Fidid Deseription ' U [Fluid Type T ) Amaunt {sacks} ’ T |Class
H20 Displacement ]
Production Casing Cement casing, 6/29/2008 11:00 "~
Comaniing Company
Halliburton Energy )
Top (hKB) = Bonom (ftkBy Full Retun? Cemént Volume Return (bbly
, 0.0 "5,590.0 . Yes 60.0 :
Fluid Destription Fluld Type Armount {sacks) Class ‘ ;
H20 Preflush z ‘ ‘
Fivig Dascription Fliid Type ‘Amoum {satks) Class :
Mud Mud Flush ’
Fluig Description Fluid Type 1Amoum {sacks) Clags
Standard "G” + 3% Econolite + 0:25% |Lead : 620 G
Polyflake + 10lb/sk Gilsonite :
Fluid Deseription Fluid Type {Amaunt {sacks) Class
POZ 50/50 + 0.2% Halad-R + Tail ; 292
0.1251bisk Palyflake + 0.3% D-AIR # :
0.2% CFR-3 '
Fluid Description Fliid Type Armount (sacks) Class
HZO Displacement
‘Dump Bail Cement (50'), plug, 6/26/2008 00:00 T o
G en’:mq yompany
Top (fKE) S T [Bottom {{KB) ! {Full Retum? Cement Volurme Return (bbl)
6,100.0 6,150.0 !
Fluid Desctiption Fluid Type e ‘ fAmoum {sacks) Class
) o Tail | G
{Cement Plug, plug, 6/28/2008 00:00. )
eriing Company

www.peloton.com Page 113 Report Printed: 7/3/2008
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RECEIVED :
JUL 252008

- B AYT E: X Well Summary
Well Name: DEVIL MESA UNIT1 13 '

Top {fiKe) - T ’sonommm) {Full Retum? Cement Viaiume Return (Gbll

0.0 50.0 i
Fluid Description ' ,f faid. Type iAmount {Sacks) Class
JTal : 8

_Cement

Cernm ting Company

Top (RKE) ’ | Bottom (KB} ) TFull Return? Cetant Vetume Return: (bl
6,010.0 6,080.0 ’

Fiuid Bescription ST Tuid Type " [Amount {sacks) Class

,fTa‘il ‘ C

Bridge Plug - Permaheht o 6.060.0' 6,085.0 6/28/2008

i Desenpton L Rep ThkE) (TR RadBate T T Pl Bate
Bridge Plug - Permanent R 6,150.0 6,166.0/6/28/2008 {

Zones.

Zore | TetRE 1 TERRE) j
Honecker | 5,420 6, 158, o}
Upperismay | . sasso| 6.291.0/A

) Cw‘mn' Statgs. . 1 Cur Stat Date
i ned 6/30/2008
bandoned 16/30/2008

R : : - - : T “Terst Dens | : ’
e Type ) Top (#KB) B""(“m' ., . 200 l showsity | Phasing (°) .l‘??’.’@ﬂ‘ﬁ*ﬂ&&i
82212008 Perforated 6,078.0 8,008.0 Honecker Orxgma! Hole 6.0 801

6/22/2008 _ |Perforated | 6,182.0! ~ 6,187.0{Upper Ismay, Original Hole 6.0 80|
6/22/2008 _ |Perforated 6,210.0 “ 6.419.0 Upper Ismay. Original Hole 6.0 60
6/1 7/2008 Perforated 6,232.0 6,238.0 Upper Ismay Ongma! Hole 4.0

6/17!2008 Perforated i 6,242.0 62510Upper Ismay, Ongmal Hole 40]

et g : e
6{1 9’12008 |Upper Ismay, Original Hole _ Acid Squeeze

Stage Type Top (HKB) Bottom (RKE) Volume Pumped (bbi)

‘Squeeze 55.232.0 6,251.0 b 1300.00

Acid Squeeze on 612312008 00:00 T
Zone 11ype

Date
612372008 Upper Ismay, Original Hole ‘ Acid Squeeze
Sig No.  iStage Type Fop {fiiK8) Botioin (WKB) Volume Purriped (bl
[Squeeze i 6,18‘2_& 6,187.0 420.00
|Acid Squeeze on 6/23/2008 00:00 e et e ST
iDate Zong Type i
6/23/2008 Upper lsmay, Original Hole: Acid Sgueeze
SigNo.  [Stage Type ’ {Top (HKB) T [Bottom (RikB) ' Volume Pumped (bl
’Squeeze i 6,210.0 , 6,219.0 750.00 :
Acid Squeeze on 6/23/2008 00:00 T i . i S ¥
Date Zore Type
6/23/2008 Honecker, Originai Hote Acid Squeeze

StgNo:  |Stage Type I - Bottorn (KB)
... ....Squeeze e &OT80 L. 80980

Sty No.

|
Voluriie Purrped-(bbl) i
19%&00"m.,.mW”w;i

op k) el
! No 1|

"Fubing Lesception’ T T T R Date ’ ’ ) 156t Depth {11KE}

JHem Bescription L DGR LABGny L Wisats 0 Grade [ nots o ket T°Rﬁ,f'!?<§),,.,‘,‘1,.,‘,,‘,.?1‘.’,’

i . x ! [

e Bestgion T T T TSt Togt TAKE]

i : :

| nem-Description 00 Nominal (i) WeightfLength {fositty |Grade Laints  {Length (/) " {Top (MKB) Botiom {RKB)
www,peloton.com Page 2/3 Report Printed:  7/4/2008




CONFIDENTIAL}

CORE ANALYSIS DATA
for

Baytex Energy USA Ltd
Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 .
Wildcat

San Juan, UT

CL File No.: DEN-080034
Date: 25th July, 08

T TRy

ey

RECEIVED
JUL 2 5 2008

DY, OF OIL, GAS & MINING

Core Lab

RESERVUOIR OPTIMIZATION



CORE LABORATORIES, INC,
HOUSTON ADVANCED TECHNOLOGY CENTER

CONFIDENTIAL

Baytex Energy USA Ltd , CL File No.: DEN-080034
Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 ‘ Date: 25th July, 08
Wildcat y Sy \ Analyst(s). JC
San Juan, UT Corelah Drilling Fluid: Oil Based Mud

CMS-300 CORE ANALYSIS DATA

Sample Net Confining Porosity Permeability Beta Alpha Grain
Number Depth Stress Kiinkenberg Kair Density Footnote
{ft) {psig) {%) {mD) (mD) ft(-1) microns gicm3
4 6314.00 Ambient 1.49 e e el e 2.629
8 6315.10 Ambient 0.73 b il i bl 2.505
8§ 6316.00 Ambient 1.64 B e o e 2.629
9 6317.00 Ambient 243 e o il ol 2.871
10 6318.00 Ambient 145 bl e i i 2612
11 6319.00 Ambient 1.59 il e il o 2.623
12 6320.00 Ambient 1.72 i il il i 2.627
13 6321.20 Ambient 1.3 il - bl e 2.620
14 8322.00 1500 1.86 278 .336 2.38E+12 2.16E+03 2€18
15 8323.00 Ambient 1.63 e i e i 2814
16 8324.00 Ambient 230 e i b o 2.608
17 6325.00 Ambient 2.64 e - b e 2.595
18 6326.00 Ambient 174 - il i - 2.588
19 6327.00 Ambient 177 il o > i 2.578
20 6328.00 Ambient 5.07 x ol i o 2.556
21 6329.10 Ambient 7.62 - il i -~ 2.594
22 6330.10 Ambient 2.36 e e ol e 2.719
23 6331.00 Ambient 0.36 bl e bl o 2.702
24 6332.00 1500 0.69 .0003 001 8.84E+15 8.13E+04 2.710
25 6333.00 Ambient 096 i i il il 2.706
26 6334.10 Ambient 1.02 s el i b 2.705
27 6335.10 Ambient 4.40 i e o bl 2.745
28 6337.00 Ambient 072 - i - - 2,709
30 6338.00 Ambient 1.29 e e o - 2.722
31 6338.90 Ambient 1.99 ox b e i 2.725
32 6340.00 1500 1.42 001 002 2.70E+13 4.72E+04 2.737
33 6341.00 Ambient 219 il bl e i 2.758
34 6341.60 1500 2.08 010 .022 9.73E+13 3.23E+03 2.769
35 6384.20 Ambient 7.35 il i e o 2.662

Page 2




CORE LABORATORIES, INC. CONFIDENTIAL

HOUSTON ADVANCED TECHNCLOGY CENTER

Baytex Energy USA Ltd , CL File No.: DEN-080034
Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 “! Date: 25th July, 08
Widcat . \ Analyst(s): JC
San Juan, UT Corelah Drilling Fluid: Oil Based Mud
CMS-300 CORE ANALYSIS DATA
Sample Net Confining Porosity Permeability Beta Alpha Grain
Number Depth Stress Klinkenberg Kair Density Footnote

{ft) {psig) (%) {(mD) {mD) ft(-1) microns gicm3

36 6385.00 Ambient 743 el i - el 2.656

37 6386.00 Ambient 6.75 hid = o bl 2643

38 6387.10 Ambient 588 s ox bl - 2.660

39 6388.00 Ambient 5.18 b i il e 2.691

Page 3



CORE LABORATORIES, INC. CONFIDENTIAL

Baytex Energy USA Ltd CL File No.: DEN-080034
Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 , ; Date: 25th July, 08
Wildcat -A\ Analyst(s): JC
San Juan, UT Caorelab Drilting Flud: Oil Based Mud

CMS - 300 CORE ANALYSIS DATA

Sample Net Confining Porosity Permeability Saturation Grain
Number Depth Stress Klinkenberg Kair ol | water Density Description Footnote
(ft) (psig) (%) {mD) {(mD) % Pore Volume glem3
4 6314.00 Ambient 1.49 b b 0 797 2829 ™D
€ 6315.10 Ambient 0.73 i e 0 94.5 2.595 TBD
8 6316.00 Ambient 1.64 el e 4 97.4 2.629 TBD
e 6317.00 Ambient 2.43 b hie 26 92.1 2.571 TBD
10 6318.00 Ambient 1.45 e A 1.2 98.2 2612 8D
11 6319.00 Ambient 1.59 == e 0 92.2 2.623 T8D
12 6320.00 Ambient 1.72 il il 54 89.6 2827 ™D
13 6321.20 Ambient 1.3 i o 4.3 90.5 2.620 TBD
14 6322.00 1500 1.86 278 .336 25 92.4 2618 TBD
15 6323.00 Ambient 1.63 ol bl 29 925 2.614 ™D
16 6324.00 Ambient 2.30 bl b 46 88.5 2.608 8D
17 6325.00 Ambient 264 il o 57 820 2.595 TBD
18 6326.00 Ambient 1.74 = i 8 82.8 2.588 TBD
19 8327.00 Ambient 1.77 i e 3.4 91.4 2.578 ™D
20 6328.00 Ambient 507 el e 1.0 458 2.556 TBD
21 6329.10 Ambient 7.62 i el 4.7 45.4 2.594 8D
22 6330.10 Ambient 2.36 el e 4.4 58.7 2719 ™bh
23 6331.00 Ambient 0.36 i - 3.5 64.4 2,702 8D
24 6332.00 1500 0.69 .00C3 .01 39 86.1 2.710 TBD
25 6333.00 Ambient 0.96 b e 1.7 45.2 2.708 TBD
26 6334.16 Ambient 1.02 i e .0 36.9 2.705 8D
27 6335.10 Ambient 4.40 il = 43 45.3 2.745 TBD
29 6337.00 Ambient 072 = - 286 58.7 2.709 TBRD
30 6338.00 Ambient 1.29 i e 87 555 2722 ™D
31 6338.90 Ambient 1.99 A i 5.0 82.3 2725 TBD
32 6340.00 1500 1.42 .001 .002 7.7 783 2737 TBD
33 6341.00 Ambient 2.19 il e .0 82.2 2.756 TBD
34 6341.80 1500 2.06 010 .022 .0 85.1 2,769 TBD
35 6384.20 Ambient 7.35 - et 88 54.8 2.662 TBD 'l
36 6385.00 Ambient 7.43 b - 6.0 56.6 2.656 TRD HECEIVED
37 6386.00 Ambient 6.75 il e 0 559 2.643 BD cons
38 6387.10 Ambient 5.88 = i 25 80.3 2.660 TBD e 2D 2008
39 6388.00 Ambient 5.18 hiskd - 6.4 837 2.691 TBD
40 6388.90 Ambient 6.12 n bl 28 44.3 2.679 8D

41 6390.00 Ambient 6.58 e 10 65.0 2642 18D vt CIL A S MINING



CORE LABORATORIES, INC. CON FID ENTIAL

Baytex Energy USA Ltd CL File No.: DEN-080034
Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 , : Date: 25th July, 08
Wildcat .‘A\ Analyst(s): JC
San Juan, UT Corelah Drilting Fluid: Oll Based Mud

CMS - 300 CORE ANALYSIS DATA

Sample Net Confining Porosity Permeability Saturation Grain
Number Depth Stress Klinkenberg Kair Qil I Water Density Description Footnote
(ft) {psig) {%) {mD) {mD) % Pore Volume gicm3
42 63¢1.00 Ambient 6.14 bl b 40 554 2837 8D
43 6392.00 Ambient 6.66 i i 6.5 55.7 2.829 ™BD
44 6393.00 Ambient 5.60 sae aen 12 628 2.351 TBD
45 6394.00 Ambient 8.59 il it 16 683 2.855 8D
45 8365.00 Ambient 7.3 e e 0 6438 2561 8D
47 63%6.00 Ambient 4.49 i - .0 76.4 2.703 ™D
48 8367.00 Ambient 7.44 bl il 16 831 2.897 8D
45 63¢8.00 Ambient 6.95 s Aa 31 851 2568 TBD
50 6369.10 Ambient 712 hid bl 21 60.5 2884 8D
51 6399.90 Ambient 6.39 el - 78 60.3 2.670 TBD
52 6401.00 Ambient 6.88 s e 50 822 2.358 TBD
53 6402.00 Ambient 8.76 hid i 34 67.4 2356 8D
54 6403.00 Ambient 3.86 w e 28 831 2345 THD
55 6404.00 Ambient 6.12 hind - .8 67.7 2347 TBD
55 6405.10 Ambient 6.89 i i 1.4 724 2.541 T™BD
57 6406.00 Ambient 8.40 e b .0 60.3 2.328 TBD
58 6407.00 Ambient 8.30 ad - 1.0 60.4 2507 ™BD
58 6408.10 Ambient 8.27 ioaid e 23 59.8 2537 TBDh
80 6409.00 Ambient 7.95 i - 1.4 638 2530 ™BD
61 6410.00 Ambient 10.67 i - 4.1 833 2.582 TBD {1)
62 6411.00 150C TBD 8D TBD T8D T8D 8D ™nD
63 6412.00 Ambient 2.46 il b 3.1 433 2572 ™Hh

Footnotes :




C()NFIDENTIAQ

Baytex Energy USA Ltd , CL File No.: DEN-080034
Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 ‘\ Date: 25th July, 08
Wildcat | ™Y \ Analyst(s), JC

San Juan, UT Corelab Drilling Fluid: Oil Based Mud

»»»» P esmantes

APPENDIX A: EXPLLANATION OF CMS-300 TERMS "b", "Beta, and "Alpha"

K. = Equivalent non-reactive liquid permeability, corrected for gas
slippage, mD
Ko = Permeability to Air, calculated using K, and b, mD
b = Klirkenberg slip factor, psi
B (Beta) = Forcheimer inertial resistance factor, ft’'
o {Alpha) = A factor equal to the product of Beta and K, This factor is employed in RECE'VED
determining the pore leve! heterogeneity index, H,
H = log-o (x@/RQI «. microns = 3.238E° 3K,
o DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
2 = Porosity, fraction
RQI = Reservoir Quality index, microns
RQI = 0.0314(K/a)°*

For further information please refer to:

Jones, S.C.. "Two-Pont Determination of Permeability and PV vs. Net Confining Stress” SPE Formation Evaluation (March 1988) 235-241.

Jones S.C.: "A Rapid Accurate Unsteady-State Klinkenberg Permeameter,” Soc. Pet. Eng. J. {(Oct 1972) 383-397.
Jones, 8.C.: “Using the inertial Coefficient, B, To Characterize Heterogeneity in Reservoir Rock: SPE 16949 (September 1987).

Amaefule, J.0.; Kersey, D.G.; Marschall, D.M.; Powell, J.D.; Valencia, L.E.; Keelan, D.K.: "Reservoir Description: A Practical Synergistic
Engineering and Geologica: Approach Based on Analysis of Core Data,: SPE Technical Canference {Oc:. 1988) SPE 18167.

Page 2



N N f' 1
Baytex Energy USA Ltd C()Nl' “““\ l IAL CL File No.. DEN-080034

Devil Mesa Unit 1-13 Date: 25th July, 08
Wildcat _ Analyst(s): JC
San Juan, UT Core Lab Drilling Fluid: Oil Based Mud
DESCRIPTION CODE KEY AND ABBREVIATIONS INTERLAM®™ THIN BED SAMPLE DESCRIPTION
LITHOLOGY FLUORESCENCE MODIFIERS
Anhy Anhydrite ev even u unconsolidated
Cgt Conglomerate stk streaks(ed) s slightly
Dol  Dolomite spt spots(ed) mod  moderately TYPE 1 TYPE 2
Sst Sandstone mott  motted v very
H Halite w well o
Sitst Svmstone INTENSITY lam laminated(ion) //,,;.\/. f\'\
Ls Limestone bt bright shy shaley o RN
Pyr  Pyrite # faint sity sty S Lo\
Sd  Sand o dul tr trace f T Ly
Sh  Shale vug  vuggy P e e .o
Sit St COLOR vt vertica! [ . "~
C Coal gy Gray intbd  interbedded { o7 .o
Ool  Odiite btk Black N - /
Bl Blue OTHER Nt Lol S
GRAIN SIZE grm Green caic  calcareous N e iyl
vfig very fine grain pnk  Pink catb  carbonaceous ”“m.__;_,/
fg fine v white cem  cementation
mg medium grain tan Tan con consolidated
cg coarse grain bra Brown dns dense LAMINATIONS <1mm - LAMINATIONS 1-5 mm
red Red fiu fiuorescence

foss  fossiliferous
frc tractured(s)

00 o0id TYPE 3 TYPE 4

OTHER ABBREVIATIONS

Por  porosity, %

Ob oil saturation, % bulk volume

Sco  core oil saturation, % pore volume

Stw total water saturation, % pore volume
Sciw  critical water saturation, % pore volume
Vsh  volume of shale, % bulk volume

Cs surface area {m“/cc)

Mean mean grain size, microns

LAMINATIONS 5-10 mm LAMINATIONS > 10 mm




CONFIDENTIAL

STATE OF UTAH AMENDED REF'ORT O FORM 8
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES m
DIVISION OF QIL, GAS AND MINING

NATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU 076834

6. [FINDIAN ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG —

p ottt
1. TYPE OF WELL:

b. T‘(APIE OF‘WORKI:“ .
NE! HORIZ,
WELL e [

ol 563 ore | THER 7. UNIT o GA AGREEMENT NAME

. O Y 4 Devil Mesa Unit UTU-085849X
DEEP. RE. DIFE 3, WELL NAME and NUMBER:

e [ ey L] Resw [ OTHER _____ , Devil Mesa Unit 1-13

P NAME OF OPERATOR:

"6, APl NUMEER:

Baytex Enerqgy USA Lid 4303731879
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: TOFIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
600-17th St. Suite 19005 e Denver state Co  zie 80202 (303) 825-2777 undesignated

4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES)
ATSURFACE: 1522 FNL 2419"FWL SE/4 NW/4

AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVAL REPORTEO BELOW: 1504* FNL 3593" FWL SW/4 NE/4

11, DIRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, BANGE,
MERIDIAD,. )

SE/H WWiN SEci3 TR R22E

; s AROTENL REORYVEWL WA KA —E};OUMT"{ 15 STATE
aTToTALDEPTH: 1601 ENL 3606° FWL SW/d NE/4 | &an Juan UTAH
14. DATE SPUDDED: 15. DATE T.D, REAGHED: |16, DATE COMPLETED, 17. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKE, RY. GL)
5972008 812712008 6/30/2008 AsanooneD (] - READY T PRODUCE [:]—’L GL: 6118" RKB: 133'
18. TOTALDEPTH: WD 6,560 . |19 PLUGBACKTD; kA ﬁ' 529 |20 1F MULTIPLE COMPLETIONS, HOWMANY? * |21, DEPTHBRIDGE D £i0nh" / (oGO
™ 6.358 o 6,207 VD SRR/ a1
22, TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MEGHAMIGAL LOGS RUN (Submitoopy of sach) [25.
WAS WELL CORED? w[] ves {Siiberit anslysis)
MPD/MDN, MAI/MFE, CMI, GR/ICBLICCL WASDST RUN? o] ves[]  wrtrenon
DIRECTIONAL SURVEY? Mol ] vES z] (Subrmit 6opy)
24. CASING AND LINER RECORD {Report all strings set in well)
HOLE SIZE SIZEGRADE | WEIGHT @t) topup) | BoTToM upy | STAGE CEMENTER Cﬁ(’;’_%'ﬂg :(:P}Es&. vofll}m%au GEMENT TOP ** | AMOUNT PULLED
16" | 14 48 0 70 Redimig 10 0 CIR 0
11" ‘§5/8" J-55__ 24 0 2,478 F'BR" 237 0 CIR 0
7 7i8" g J-55 11.6 0 6,590 390 0.CBL 0
‘25, TUBING RECORD
SIZE DEFTH SET (MD) | PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) | PACKER SET (MD} SIZE DERTH SET (MD) | PACKER'SET (MD)

26. PRODUCING INTERVALS

27. PERFORATION RECORD

v ——G————————
FORMATICN NAME

TOP (WD) BOTTOM (MD) | TOP (IVD) | BOTTOM (TWE) | INTERVAL (ToprBot - MD) SIZE. I NO. HOLES PERFORATION STATUS

#) Monecker Trail 5,942 6,158 5,712 5926 leors ~(ode | 25 138 |open @ Squeszed ]
© Upper Ismay 86,158 6,291 | 5926 6,059 Yuiwz - &gt mwmﬂ 25 84 |open [/] squeerea [
© e . . . i | R soaz-wsi| 26 BO |Open [f] Soueezed [ ]
D I Lo Open || Squeezed [ |
28, ACID, FRACTUHE, TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, EYC. T

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNT AND TYPE GF MATERIAL
BO75-6098 19300al, 15% HCL selective acid squeeze

6182-6187 6210-6219

420gal 15% HCL selective acid squeeze 6182-6187 and 750gal 15% acid squeeze 8210-6219

6232-6238 62426251

1300gal 18% HCL acid squeeze 6232-6251

29, ENCLOSED ATTACHIMENTS:

30 WELL STAYUS:

ELECTRICALIMECHANICAL LOGS ‘ GEQLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT I%DIRECTIONAL SURVEY Ty
= O] sorr [ | Abandoned

] SunoRY NOTIGE FOR PLUGEING AND CEMENT VERIFICATION M CORE ANALYSIS M orver: e

{5/2000)

{CONTINUED ON BACK) ¥ UL 2 5 2008
i OF OIL, GAS & MINING



31. INITIAL PRODUCTION

INTERVAL A {As shown i item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION JOIL - 88L: GAS ~MCF:  |WATER -BBL: |PROD METHGO:
6/27/2008 18 RATES -+ 11 40 0 swab
CHOKE SIZE: JTBG. PRESS. [CSG PRESS.  [APIGRAVITY |BTU-GAS GASIOIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL = 8By GAS - MCF WATER ~ BBL.  JINTERVAL STATUS:
1.69 1 303 41.40 |RATEST =
INTERVAL B (As shown in item #26)
DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION. JOIL «-BBL: GAS — MCF: WATER - BBL [PROD. METHOD:
6/27/2008 18 RATES: = 11 | 40 0 swab
CHOKE SI2E:  |TBG. PRESS. |CSG. PRESS.  [APIGRAVITY  |8TU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO" |24 HR PRODUCTION fOIL -~ BBL: GAS ~ MCF: WATER - 8BL:  [INTERVAL STATUS:
169 | 1 303 41.10 RATES: =
’ INTERVAL C (A5 shown In ifem #26) ) ]
DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE:! HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION oI - BBL: GAS ~ MCF: WATER ~BBL:  [PROD, METHOD:
RATES: -~
CHOKE SIZE: |TBG. PRESS. |CSG. PRESS. |APIGRAVITY  [BTU-GAS GAS/QIL RATIO. [24 HR PRODUCTION olL ~ BRBL- GAS - MCF |WATER -~ BBL. llNTERVAL STATUS:
RATES:
_ INTERVAL B (As shown initem #26)
DATE FIRST PRODUCED! TEST DATE: HOWRS TESTED: TEST PROCUCTION JOIL - BBL: GAS ~ MCF: WATER = BBL:  [PROD. METHOD:
RATES: =+
CHOKE SIZE  |TBG. PRESS,  [CSG. PRESS.  |APIGRaVITY  [BTU-GAS GASIOIL RATIO |24 MR PRODUCTION {OIL - BBL: GAS ~MCF: WATER - BBL: I!NTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: -~
32, DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented; Etc.)
vented
33. SUMMARY OF POROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION (Log) MARKERS:
Show all imgortant zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all dril-ster tests, including depth interval
tested, cushion uged, time tool open, fowing and shiut-in pressures snd recoveries.
. Top Bottom L Top
Farmation MO} (MD) Descrigtions, Contents, ate. Name (Mea sured Depth)
Shinarump 2,602
Hovenweep 6,291 6,325 | Cored 6312-6342 Moenkopt 2,735
Gothic 6,372 6,404 | Cored 6384-6414 Cutler 3.095
Hermosa 5.091
U. Ismay 6,158
Hovenweep 6,291
L. Ismay 6,325
Gothic 8,372
Desert Creak 6,404
Chimnevy Rock 6,476
35. ADDITIONAL REMARKS {Include plugging p 1

Attached abandonment details

38. | hereby certify that the feregoing and

hod infe

NAME (PLEASE prINT DaVid Friesen

is 2

SIGNATURE

and correct as détermined from all avallable records,

rme Manager, Drilling and Completions

DATE

71412008

L ’
This report must be suﬁMin 30 days of
o completing or plugging a new well

e drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore
e recompleting to & different producing formation

» reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well

¥ |TEM 20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from twa or more formations.

* significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
e drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

**ITEM 24: Cement Top ~ Show how reported top(s) of cement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL), cement bond log (CBL), temperature survey (TS)).

Send to:

Utah Division of Ofl, Gas and Mining

Phone: 801-538-5340

1594 Wast North Temple, Suite 1210

Box 145801

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

{6/2000)

Fax: 801-359-3940
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DIRECTIONAL SURVEY CALCULATION

MINIMUM CURVATURE METHOD

DIV.OF OIL, GAS s MINING

bevil MNasoc v 1 13
43037 i @"]Cf

Well Name Target Direction | Slot N/S E/W |Hole Size |Calculation by Date
Devil Mesa Unit #1193.84 Coordinate 0.00 0.00{ = 7.875 ; 6/11/08
Job Number Type of Survey Tie-in Point Directional Co.
RM-08222 MWD PLAN AT SURFACE »>»=<<< |DDC _
Meaured | Hole Hole Course | True Vertical | Vertical __Total Coordinate | Dogleg [Build Up| Walk/

Depth | Angle | Direction | Length Depth Section | N+/8- | E+IW=-] Severity | 100 # | 1001
2204 200 31970 2203.55 26.81] 29.30  -24.90 << TIE-IN POINT >>
2268 0.70 4.90 64 2,267.53 =27:58 30.b4 <2559 2.48 -2.03{ -491.88
2331 3.70 87.00 63 :2,330.49 -25.55 31.03 -23.53 5.83 4.786 150.32
2394 6.10 86.10 63 2,393.25 -20.21 31.37] ~ -18.18] 381 3.81 -1.43]
2487 6.90 §7.80 63 2,455.85 1318 3174, -11.03 1.31 1.27] ZZ,.Q.
2520 7.40 99.60 B3. 2,518.36 -5.33 31.21 -3.25 248 079 18.73
2583 810  104.40 63 2,580.71 . 3.60 29.291 5.57 291 270 7.62
2646 10.80 107.20 B3 2,642.76 14.24 26.31 16.04 2.80 2.70 4.44
2709 12.00  103.80 63 2,704.51 26.44 23.00 28.04 2.18 1.90 -5.40
2772 12.90 101.80 63 2,766.03 38.85 19.99] 4128 1.67] 1.43 -3.02
2835 13.80 95.40 63 2,827.33 54.32 17.83 55.64 278 1.43 -10.32
2899 17.00  100.70 B84 2,889.03 71.25] 1537 72.44 5,46 5.00 8.28
2062 18.40  100.20 63 2,949.04 90.28 11.90 91.28 2.24 2.22 -0.79
3026 19,90  100.70 64 3,000.50 111,13 8.09 111,92 2,36 2.34 D.78}
3089 21.00  98.70 B3 3,068.53 133.02 4.39 133.62 207 1.75] -3.17
3152 22.00 98.60 B3 3,127.15 156.03 0.92 156.44 .48 1.68 ~0.16
3215 23.70 98.00 63 3,185.20 180.42 -2.61 180.65| 272 2.70 -0.95
3278 2450  96.30 63 3,242.71 206.10 -5.80 20817 1.68] 1.27 =2.70
3374 27.60 92.20 96 3,328.95 248.23 -8.84 248.20 373 3.23 -4.27
3437 26.40 80.30 83 3,385.09 276.80 -9.47] 278.79 2:35 -1.80 -3.02
3499 26.30 9280 62 3,440.65 304.29 -10.22 304 .29 1.80 .16 403
3562 2540  94.00 63 3,497.34] 33176 -11.84 331.71 1.65 -1.43 1.90
3824 2640 94.00 62 3,563.11 358.84/ “13.73 358.72 1.6% 1.81 _0.00
3689 26.20 94.20 65 361139 38764 -15.79 387.45 0.34 -0.31 0.31
3788 25.70 92.60 96 3,697.71 429.64 -18.29 429.38 0.90 -0.52 -1.67
3876 26.20 91.20 91 3,779.53 469.44 -18.60 469:18 0.87 0.55 -1.64
3971 25.90 92.80 85 3,864.88 51113}  -21.06 510.87 0.80 0,32 1.68
4086 25.80 894.30 95 3,8560.38 552.55 -23:82) 552.21 0.70 -0.11 1.58
4164 25.90 93.50 98 4,038.57 595.28 -26.52; 594 84 087 0.10 <0.82
4256 25.90 94,50 92 4,121.33 6835.46 -29.33 634.92 0.47 0.00} 1.09
4350 2570  96.50 94 4,205.98] 676.35 -33.25| 67564 0.95 ~0.21 2.13
4447 26.50 84.50 97 4,293.07 719.00 -37.32 71811 1.23 0.82 -2.06
4539 2540 95.60 92 4,375.80, 759.25 -40, 86|  758.21 1,31 -1.20 1.20
4634 23.40 84.00 95 4,462.31] 798.48 -44.17 797.31 2.22 -2.11 -1.68
4729 23.10 93.50 95 4,549,589 835,98 -46.82 834.73 0.38 -0.32 -0.53
4824 2270 96.30 95 463711 872.93 4977  871.56 1.22 -0.42 2.95
4918 21.10 04.20 94 4,724.32 907.98 -53.00 206,46 m =1.70] -2.23
5013 21.50 93.80 85 4.812.83 242.48 -55.40] 940.849] = 045 042 -0.42
5108 21.30 92.80 83 4,899.42 8976.41 -57.39) 974.76 0.41 ~0.22 -0.97
8201 19.20 89.80 85 4.088.55] 100825 -58.21] 1.007.62 2.48 ~2,21 -3.26
5298 16.90 92.90 94 5077.92] 1,038.34 -58.84] 1,088.72 2.65 =245 3.30
5390 15.60 83.70 g5 5160.12] 1,064.92 <80.37| 1,063.26 1.39 -1.371 0.84
5486 14.00 9610 96 5261.93] 1,089.43 62431 1,087.69 1.78 -1,67 2.50]
5580 12.20 98.40 04 5353.48| 1,110.70 «65.09{ 1,108.83 1,99 ~1.91 2.45
56875 10.00 93.80 95 5446701 1,128.85 6711 1,126.99 2.49 -2.32 -4, 84
§770 8.80 91.40 ob 5540.43] 1,144.46 -B7.83] 1,142.48] 1.33 -1.28 -2.53
5862 7.60 95.20 92 5631.49| 1,157.58 -68.55] 1,155.58 1.43] -1.30 413
5958 5.40 10480 | 94 5,726.86| 1 16836l -70.29] 1,166.27 2.55 -2.29 10.10
85053 4.50 84.00 95 5821.51] 1,176.47 -71.70} 1 174,31 1.37 -0.95 -11.47
6147 2.70 97.30 94 5915,32] 1,182.37 72,241 1,180.18 1.93 -1.91 3.51
8210 1.00 122.70 83 597829 118433 72,731 118212 2.93 ~2.70 40.32




DIRECTIONAL SURVEY CALCULATION
MINIMUM CURVATURE METHOD

Well Name Target Direction Slot N78 E/W |Hole Size

Calculation by Date
Devil Mesa Unit#1193.84 Coordinate , 0.001 0.001 7.875 6/11/08
Job-Number { Type of Survey { Tie-in Point ‘ Directional Co.

RM-08222 MWD |PLAN- AT SURFAGE »>>»<<< DDC _
Meaured [ Hole Hole | Course | True Vertical | Vertical Total Coordinate | Dogleg | Build Up| Walk/
Depth | ‘Angle | Direction | Length Depth Section: | N+/§- | E+/[W- | Severity | °/100ft | °/100ft

2204 200 31870 2203.55 28.81| 29.30  -24.90 << TIE-IN POINT >>

6242 070 14510 32 6,010.28] 1,184.70 ~13.04] 1,182.46 1.38 -0.94]  70.00
6262 1.20 141.30 20 6,030.28| 1.184.92 -73.301 1,182.66 2.52 2.50 -18.00
6590 1.20 141.30 328 | 6,358.21|  1,189.56 -78.66] 1,186.96 0.00 0.00 0.00
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DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

STATE OF UTAH

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM g

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU 076834

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottem-hole depth, reenter piugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IFINDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Devil Mesa Unit UTU-085849X

1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
olLweLL [] GAS WELL OTHER Abandoned Devil Mesa Unit 1-13
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Baytex Energy USA Lid 4303731879
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
600-17th Street, Suite 1900S ., Denver state CO 780202 (303) 825-2777 Undesignated

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 1522' FNL, 2419' FWL

county: San Juan

11/14/2008

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: S& W & 4 = STATE:
C T3 238
_ UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[] aciize [] oeepen [] REPERFORATE GURRENT FORMATION
[] noTICE OF INTENT
{Submit in Duplicate) [] ALtercasing [T] FrACTURE TREAT [} sioeTrRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start; [] casinG REPAIR [] ~ewconsTRucTION [[] TeMPORARILY ABANDON
[] cHANGE TOPREVIOUS PLANS [] operaTOR cHaNGE 7] TuBinG REPAIR
[] cHancETUBING [ PLuG AND ABANDON [] veNTORFLARE
(/] SUBSEQUENT REPORT ] crance WeLL NAME [ ruesack ] waterDisPosaL
(Submit Original Form Only}
[] CHANGE WELL STATUS [C] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [T wATER sHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:
[] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE (1 orHer:

CONVERT WELL TYPE

RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The surface location of the subject well has now been re-contured, reclaimed and seeded as per the conditions of the APD and

associated approvals.

NAME (PLEAsE privt)_DAVid Friesen

/7

TITLE

SIGNATURE

-~

Manager Drilling & Completions

11/14/2008

DATE

/\\5\

{This space for State usw

(5/2000)

! RECEIVED
. NOV 17 258

(See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MiniiNG
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