
CONFIDENTL STATE OF UTAH FORM 3
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING AMENDEDREPORT
(highlight changes)

5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL ML-47576

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:
1A.TYPEOFWORK: DRILL REENTER DEEPEN O N/A

O O O 7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
B. TYPE OF WELL: OIL GAS OTHER SINGLE ZONE MULTIPLEZONE V N/A

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

MSCEXPLORATION L. P. 16800 IMPERIALVALLEYDR., SUITE 380 STATE MSC 35-1
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

ciTy HOUSTON STATE TX ZIP 77060 (281) 931-8933 WILDCAT
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) 10. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

ATSURFACE: 470 FNL & 1320 FWL (po4'l Ÿy &Ÿ. 9 fjÿ9Â N 35 21S 19E S
AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONE: SAME g((§§ - ¡ og, M /

13. DISTANCE IN MILESAND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: 11. COUNTY: 12. STATE:

1 MILEEAST OF CRESCENT JUNCTION GRAND UTAH

14. DISTANCE TO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE(FEET) 15. NUMBEROF ACRES IN LEASE: 16. NJMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:

470 1,600 160
17. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING,COMPLETED, OR 18. PROPOSED DEPTH: 19. BOND DESCRIPTION:

APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET)

N/A 7,800 STATE WIDE (to be submitted)
20. ELEVATIONS (SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 21. APPROXIMATE DATE WORK WILLSTART: 22. ESTIMATEDDURATION:

4,876 GL 6/21/2004 6 WEEKS (to drill&complete)

23. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, ANDWEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY,YIELD,ANDSLURRY WEIGHT

12-1/4 8-5 K-55 24 500 CLASS G 350 SX 1.18 15.2
7-7/8 5-1/2 N-80 17 7,800 BLEND 300 SX 3.82 11.0

50/50 POZ 300 SX 1.21 14.4

24. ATTACHMENTS

VERIFY THE FOLLOWINGARE ATTACHEDIN ACCORDANCE WITHTHE UTAHOIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES:

WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLINGPLAN

EVIDENCE OF DIVISIONOF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANYOTHER THANTHE LEASE OWNER

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) BRIAN WOOD PHONE: (505) 466-8120
TITLE CONSULTANT FAX:(505) 466-9682

SIGNATURE DATE 5/31/2004

(This space for State use only) ECEIVE,

API NUMBER ASSIGNED: APPROVAL:

(5/2000) (SeelnatructionsonReverseSIde) DIVOF OIL, GAS & MIN
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WellLocation Description
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Section 35. T.21S.. R.19E.. SLM
Grand County. UT
4876 grd. el. ( from GPS)
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The above is true and correct to my knowledgeand belief.

HUDDLESTONLANDSURVEYlNG- BOXKK - CORTEZ.CO - (970) 565
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WORKSHEET
PLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRIL

APD RECEIVED: 06/01/2004 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-019-31404

WELL NAME: STATE MSC 35-1

OPERATOR: MSC EXPLORATION, LP ( N2595 )

CONTACT: BRIAN WOOD PHONE NUMBER: 505-466-8120

PROPOSED LOCATION:

NWNW 35 210S 190E INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
SURFACE: 0470 FNL 1320 FWL Tech Review Initials Date
BOTTOM: 0470 FNL 1320 FWL

GRAND Engineering /

WILDCAT ( 1 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 3 - State Surface
LEASE NUMBER: ML-47576

SURFACE OWNER: 3 - State
LATITUDE: 38.94853

PROPOSED FORMATION: WINGT

COALBED METHANE WELL? NO LONGITUDE: 109.79147

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

/ Plat R649-2-3.

Bond:Fed[] Ind[] Sta[3] Fee[]

Potash (Y/N) ,cc

R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

Water Permit \/ R649-3-3. Exception
(No.92-117 )

\ RDCC Review (Y/N)
Drilling Unit

(Date: 06/23/2004 ) Board Cause No:
Eff Date:

A Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:

STIPULATIONS : i
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4,876 GL 6/21/2004 6 WEEKS (todrill&complete)
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WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLINGPLAN
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ÛÛ INC.

PROVIDING PERMITS for LAND USERS
37 Verano Loop Santa Fe, New Mexico 87508 (505) 466-8120

May 31, 2004
Diana Whitney
Utah Div. of Oil, Gas, & Mining
P. O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Ut. 84114-5801

Dear Diana,

On behalf of MSCExploration L. P., I am applying for approval of an exception
location for their State MSC 35-1 wildcat gas well in Section 35, T. 21 S., R.
19 E., Grand County. I am requesting an exception because of topography and
land use.

This well is staked at 470' FNL & 1320' FWL on a 1,600 acre state lease. An
orthodox well was planned for a seismically defined target at 470' FNL &
21 50' FWL, but this fell into a mix of I-70, I-70 right-of-way fence, erosion
control dikes protecting I-70, power lines, and a deep arroyo. It was only
after the well was moved 830' west that a suitable location was found. MSC
is requesting permission to drill at 470' FNL & 1320' FWL 35-21s-19e. This
is the only oil or gas well existing or planned in the quarter-quarter. The only
wells of any type within a mile radius are two P&A wells. Closest lease line is
470' north. MSC is owner of all drilling units within a minimum 470' radius of
the proposed exception. This includes all of Section 35. The drilling unit
(NENW Sec. 35) toward which the well encroaches is part of the same MSC
state lease.

Please keep this well "CONFIDENTIAL".
Sincerely,

Brian Wood
cc: Faust

Jones

JUN- | 2004

DIVOF OIL, GAS &
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ÛÛ$ MSCExploration L. P. PAGE1
State MSC35-1
470' FNL& 1320' FWL
Sec. 35, T. 21 S., R. 19 E.
Grand County, Utah CONFIDENTIAL

Drillina Program

1. Formation Name Depth from GL Depth from KB Elevation

Mancos Shale O' 12' +4,876'

Dakota Sandstone 1,971' 1,983' +2,905'

Morrison formation +2,460'

Moab Tongue 3,694' 3,706' +2,065'

Wingate Sandstone 4,964' 4,976' +460'

White Rim Sandstone 5,764' 5,766' -1,035'

Base of White Rim 6,667' 6,679' -1,635'

Total Depth 7,800' 7,812' -2,924'

(All depths are based on an ungraded ground level of 4,876')

2. NOTABLEZONES

Pennsylvanian is the primary goal. Other potential oil or gas zones are the
Dakota, Moab, Wingate, and White Rim. The Glen Canyon group of sandstones
are possible water zones.

3. PRESSURECONTROL (Also see "5." on PAGE 2)

A 3,000 psi BOP and choke manifold will be used from the bottom of the
surface casing to TD. (A typical 3,000 psi BOP system is on Page 3. Actual
model will not be known until the bid is let.) BOP Equipment and the 8 5/8
casing will be pressure tested to rated pressures prior to drilling out of the
8 5/8" surface casing. BOP rams will be function tested on trips and the
stack will be pressure tested every 30 days if necessary. Tests will be
recorded in the driller's log. BOPs will be inspected and operated daily to
assure good mechanical working order.

.INC

PROVI ING PfRMils for I AND

ÛÛ$ MSCExploration L. P. PAGE1
State MSC35-1
470' FNL& 1320' FWL
Sec. 35, T. 21 S., R. 19 E.
Grand County, Utah CONFIDENTIAL

Drillina Program

1. Formation Name Depth from GL Depth from KB Elevation

Mancos Shale O' 12' +4,876'

Dakota Sandstone 1,971' 1,983' +2,905'

Morrison formation +2,460'

Moab Tongue 3,694' 3,706' +2,065'

Wingate Sandstone 4,964' 4,976' +460'

White Rim Sandstone 5,764' 5,766' -1,035'

Base of White Rim 6,667' 6,679' -1,635'

Total Depth 7,800' 7,812' -2,924'

(All depths are based on an ungraded ground level of 4,876')

2. NOTABLEZONES

Pennsylvanian is the primary goal. Other potential oil or gas zones are the
Dakota, Moab, Wingate, and White Rim. The Glen Canyon group of sandstones
are possible water zones.

3. PRESSURECONTROL (Also see "5." on PAGE 2)

A 3,000 psi BOP and choke manifold will be used from the bottom of the
surface casing to TD. (A typical 3,000 psi BOP system is on Page 3. Actual
model will not be known until the bid is let.) BOP Equipment and the 8 5/8
casing will be pressure tested to rated pressures prior to drilling out of the
8 5/8" surface casing. BOP rams will be function tested on trips and the
stack will be pressure tested every 30 days if necessary. Tests will be
recorded in the driller's log. BOPs will be inspected and operated daily to
assure good mechanical working order.
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4. CASING& CEMENTING

Hole Size O. D. Weight Grade Tvoe & Setting Depth

12-1/4" 8-5/8" 24 K-55 ST & C New 500'
7-7/8" 5-1/2" 17 N-80 LT & C New 7,800'

AII tubular goods will be new or inspected to premium specifications. Casing

strings will be pressure tested to 0.22 psi/ft of casing string length or to

1,500 psi whichever is greater (not to exceed 70% of the internal yield

strength of the casing), after cementing and prior to drilling out from under

the casing shoe. Surface casing shoe will be set in a competent formation. A

pressure integrity test of each casing shoe shall be performed. Formation at

the shoe shall be tested to a minimum of the mud weight equivalent
anticipated to control the formation pressure to the next casing depth or at
total depth of the well. This test shall be performed before drilling more than
20 feet of new hole.

Surface casing will be cemented to the surface with ~350 sacks (~100%
excess) Class G (weight = 15.2 pounds per gallon & yield 1.18 cubic feet per

sack).

Production casing will be cemented to the surface. Lead cement willconsist
of ~300 sacks Blend weight (weight = 11.0 pounds per gallon & yield = 3.82

cubic feet per sack). Tail with ~300 sacks 50/50 poz (weight = 14.4 pounds

per gallon & yield 1.21 cubic feet per sack). Wait on cement, set slips with

casing in full tension. Actual volumes to be determined after reviewing logs

and shows. All potentially productive zones will be covered with cement.

5. MUD PROGRAM

Will drill from surface to ~500' with air and/or fresh water mud system. Will

drill from ~500' to ~3,000' with air mist. Will drill remainder of hole with

aerated LSND.
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6. DATA GATHERING

May cut cores or may run drill stem tests depending on shows. Two mud
loggers will be on site from ~500' to TD and will collect samples every 10'.

They will have FIDand chromatograph unit. Willrun following log suites:

GR/Dual Induction - SFL
GR/Bore Hole Compensated Sonic

GR/Neutron Density
Continuous Dip meter - FMI

Gamma Ray - Directional

7. DOWNHOLEÇONDITIONS

Maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure is ~3,377 psi. No hydrogen

sulfide, abnormal pressures, nor abnormal temperatures are expected.

8. MISCELLANEOUS

Projected spud date is June 21, 2004. It will take ~3 weeks to drill the well
and ~2 weeks to complete the well.
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Surface Use Plan

1. EXISTINGROADS& DIRECTIONS(See PAGES9 - 11)

From the closed gas station at Crescent Junction (Exit #180 on 1-70) ...

Go East 1.2 miles on a paved county road 175 to ~150' East of MilePost 154

Then turn right and follow flags cross country SE for 1,1 59.39' to the well

2. ROADTO BE BUILT(See PAGES10 & 11)

No upgrading is needed as long as the county weight limit (30 tons) is obeyed.
The 1,159.39' of new road will be crowned and ditched with a ~14' wide

running surface. The first 50' of road south from the pavement will be

graveled with 4" of 4" minus pit run topped with 2" of gravel. Maximum

disturbed width = 40'. Maximum grade = 1%. Maximum cut or fill = 1'.

3. EXISTINGWELLS(See PAGE 10)

There are no existing water, injection, disposal, oil, or gas wells within a mile

radius. There are two P & A wells.

4. PROPOSEDPRODUCTIONFACILITIES

A tank battery, separator, and pump will be installed on the pad. All surface

equipment will be painted a flat juniper green color.
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5. WATERSUPPLY

Water will be trucked from Thompson and Marsing Construction and Ready
Mix (right #92-117) in Green River or Thompson Special Service District

(right #92-180) in Thompson Springs.

6. CONSTRUCTIONMATERIALS& METHODS(See PAGES 12 & 13)

Beware of low power lines south of the pad. Topsoil and brush will be stripped
and piled north of the pad. Pit subsoil will be piled north of the pit. A

diversion ditch will be cut north of the piles. Gravel will be bought from a
private source.

7. WASTEDISPOSAL

The reserve pit will be fenced 4' high on 3 sides with 4 strands of barbed
wire or woven wire topped with barbed wire. The fourth side will be fenced
once the rig moves off hole. The fence will be kept in good repair while the pit
dries.

All trash will be placed in a trash cage. When full, it will be hauled to a state
approved landfill. There will be no trash burning or disposal of trash in the
reserve pit. Chemical toilets will be used for. human waste. Their contents will
be disposed of in state approved facilities.

No oil will be allowed on the reserve pit. Any oil which accumulates on the pit
will be pumped or skimmed off and hauled to a state approved recycle
facility. Once dry, the reserve pit contents will be buried in place.
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8. ANÇ\LLARYFACILITIES

There will be no airstrip or formal camp. Camper trailers will be on site for
the company man, roughnecks, mud logger, tool pusher, etc.

9. WELLSITELAYOUT

See PAGES 12 & 13 for depictions of the well pad, cross sections, cut and fill
diagrams, reserve pit, burn pit, access road onto the pad, parking, living
facilities, and rig orientation.

10. REÇLAMATION

After completing drilling, the well site and immediate area will be cleared of
all debris and material not needed for production.

Reclamation will start when the reserve pit is dry. At least 2' of cover will be
placed on the reserve pit. All areas not needed for production will be back
filled, contoured to a natural shape, and reserved topsoil evenly spread. If
the well is a producer, then enough topsoil will be kept aside to reclaim the
rest of the pad. Disturbed areas will be ripped, harrowed, or scarified before
seeding.

All reclaimed areas will be broadcast seeded in late fall or winter with a seed
mix specified by the State. Seeded areas will be left rough and lightly
harrowed or drug with a chain after seeding.

11. SURFACEOWNER

All construction is on lease and on State and Institutional Trust Land.
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12. OTHERINFORMATION

Closest first aid is the Green River Medical Center at 305 West Main in Green
River, Utah. Its phone number is (435) 564-3434. It is a ~20 minute drive.

Closest hospital is Allen Memorial Hospital at 719 West 400 North in Moab.
Its phone number is (435) 259-7191. It is a ~30 minute drive.

13. REPRESENTATION

Anyone having questions concerning the APD should contact:

Brian Wood
Permits West, Inc.
37 Verano Loop
Santa Fe, NM87508
(505) 466-8120 FAX:(505) 466-9682 Mobile: (505) 699-2276

The operator's contact is:

Lynn Faust or Jack Stanley
MSCExploration L. P.
16800 Imperial Valley Dr., Suite 380
Houston, TX 77060
(281) 931-8933 FAX (281) 931-8655 Mobile: (832) 434-9900
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ON-SITE PREDRILL EVALUATION
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

OPERATOR: MSC Exploration L.P.
WELL NAME & NUMBER: MSC 35-1
API·NUMBER: 43-019-31404
LEASE: State FIELD/UNIT:
LOCATION: 1/4,1/4 NWNW Sec: 35 TWP: 21S RNG: 19E 470 FNL 1320 FWL
LEGAL WELL SITING: 460 F SEC. LINE; 460 F 1/4,1/4 LINE; 920 F ANOTHER WELL.
GPS COORD (Inmi): X = E; Y = N SURFACE OWNER: SITLA.

PARTICIPANTS
M. Jones (DOGM), Brian Wood (Permits West).

REGIONAL/LOCAL SETTING & TOPOGRAPHY

Proposed location is ~2 miles east of Crescent Junction on I-70 and ~5

miles west of Thompson Springs, Utah. Staked location lies north of
Interstate 70 and south of the old highway between Crescent Junction and
Thompson Springs. Access to the proposed site is off of the old highway.

Approximately 1160' of new access will be built to access this well.
The direct area drains to the south.

SURFACE USE PLAN

CURRENT SURFACE USE: Wildlife habitat and grazing.

PROPOSED SURFACE DISTURBANCE: 215' x 285' and a 165' x 75' x 10' pit.
266 feet of new access road will be built for this well.

LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHIN A 1 MILE RADIUS: None.

LOCATION OF PRODUCTION FACILITIES AND PIPELINES: Production facilities
will be on location and no pipeline is planned for at this time.

SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL: Obtained locally and transported in.

ANCILLARY FACILITIES: None anticipated.

WASTE MANAGEMENT PLAN:

The reserve pit will be fenced 4' high on 3 sides with 4 strands of
barbed wire or woven wire topped with barbed wire. The fourth side will
be fenced once the rig moves off the hole. The fence will be kept in
good repair while the pit dries. All trash will be placed in a trash
cage. When full, it will be hauled to a state approved landfill. There
will be no trash burning or disposal of trash in the reserve pit.
Chemical toilets will be used for human waste. Their contents will be
disposed of in state approved facilities. No oil will be allowed on the
reserve pit. Any oil which accumulates on the pit will be skimmed off
and hauled to a state approved recycle facility. Once dry, the reserve
pit contents will be buried in place. The pit will be back filled
sufficiently deep so no liner is
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Interstate 70 and south of the old highway between Crescent Junction and
Thompson Springs. Access to the proposed site is off of the old highway.

Approximately 1160' of new access will be built to access this well.
The direct area drains to the south.

SURFACE USE PLAN

CURRENT SURFACE USE: Wildlife habitat and grazing.

PROPOSED SURFACE DISTURBANCE: 215' x 285' and a 165' x 75' x 10' pit.
266 feet of new access road will be built for this well.

LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHIN A 1 MILE RADIUS: None.

LOCATION OF PRODUCTION FACILITIES AND PIPELINES: Production facilities
will be on location and no pipeline is planned for at this time.

SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL: Obtained locally and transported in.

ANCILLARY FACILITIES: None anticipated.

WASTE MANAGEMENT PLAN:

The reserve pit will be fenced 4' high on 3 sides with 4 strands of
barbed wire or woven wire topped with barbed wire. The fourth side will
be fenced once the rig moves off the hole. The fence will be kept in
good repair while the pit dries. All trash will be placed in a trash
cage. When full, it will be hauled to a state approved landfill. There
will be no trash burning or disposal of trash in the reserve pit.
Chemical toilets will be used for human waste. Their contents will be
disposed of in state approved facilities. No oil will be allowed on the
reserve pit. Any oil which accumulates on the pit will be skimmed off
and hauled to a state approved recycle facility. Once dry, the reserve
pit contents will be buried in place. The pit will be back filled
sufficiently deep so no liner is



ENVIRONMENTAL PARAMETERS

AFFECTED FLOODPLAINS AND/OR WETLANDS: Dry washes.

FLORA/FA NA: Halogeton, greasewood, antelope, small game, raptors and
other fowl, rodents and reptiles.

SOIL TYPE AND CHARACTERISTICS: Clay.

EROSION/SEDIMENTATION/STABILITY: Stable until disturbed.

PALEONTOLOGICAL POTENTIAL: None observed.

RESERVE PIT

CHARACTERISTICS: Dugout earthen.

LINER REQUIREMENTS (Site Ranking Form attached): Liner optional.

SURFACE RESTORATION/RECLAMATION PLAN

As per surface use agreement.

SURFACE AGREEMENT: In negotiation with landowner.

CULTURAL RESOURCES/ARCHAEOLOGY: Arch survey completed by Grand River
Institute. Clear, and submitted to SITLA.

OTHER OBSERVATIONS/COMMENTS

ATTACHMENTS

Photos of this location were taken and placed on file.

Mark L. Jones June 2, 2004 / 10:00 am
DOGM REPRESENTATIVE
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uation Ranking Criteria and Ranking e
For Reserve and Onsite Pit Liner Requirements

Site-Specific Factors Ranking Site Ranking

Distance to Groundwater (feet)
>200 0
100 to 200 5
75 to 100 10
25 to 75 15
<25 or recharge area 20 0

Distance to Surf. Water (feet)
>1000 0
300 to 1000 2
200 to 300 10
100 to 200 15
< 100 20 0

Distance to Nearest Municipal
Well (feet)

>5280 0
1320 to 5280 5
500 to 1320 10
<500 20 0

Distance to Other Wells (feet)
>1320 0
300 to 1320 10
<300 20 0

Native Soil Type
Low permeability 0
Mod. permeability 10
High permeability 20 ___5

Fluid Type
Air/mist 0
Fresh Water 5
TDS >5000 and <10000 10
TDS >10000 or Oil Base Mud Fluid 15

containing significant levels of
hazardous constituents 20 10

Drill Cuttings
Normal Rock 0
Salt or detrimental 10 0

Annual Precipitation (inches)
<10 0
10 to 20 5
>20 10 O

Affected Populations
<10 0
10 to 30 6
30 to 50 8
>50 10 0

Presence of Nearby Utility
Conduits

Not Present 0
Unknown 10
Present 15 0

Final Score 15 (Level II Sensitivity)

Sensitivity14vel I = 20 or more; totalçontpinment is reqvired.
Sensitivitv I.evel II = 15-19: lining is discretionarv.
Sensitivity Izvel III = below 15; no specific lining is required
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SOUTHEASTERN UTAHASSOCIATION OF LOCAL GOVERNMENTS

DREw Simaud In Soevh CARbom AVE.
ChAIRMAN y PO. DRAWER 1106

PaicE, UTAh 84¾)l

E

VEÛÑOWEË

R G REVIEW

Federal Action State Action x Approved ( x ) Yes ( ) No

Other (indicate)

Applicant Address:

Oil, Gas & Mining

1594 West North Temple #1210

SLC, UT 84114-5801 Name and phone number Diana Whitney 801-538-5312

Title/Project Description Application for Permit to Drill - Well to be drilled on State Lease

ML-47576, Grand County.

[ ] No Comment
[ ] See comment below

Comments: Approved on 6/10/04 at SEUAOG Executive Board Meeting.

6/10/04
SEUALG " DATE

AREA AQENCy ON AQiNQ • SMAfÊBUSINESS DEVEËOpMENT CENTER • BUSINESS ÍNcubATION • COMMUNITYÜEVEIOpMENT/ŸÊANNINQ• COMMUNITy SERVICEs • EcONOMic DEVElOpMENT

NTTP://WWW.SBUalg.dst.ut.us •
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DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

STATEMENT OF BASIS

OPERATOR: MSC Exploration L.P.
WELL NAME & NUMBER: MSC 35-1
API NUMBER: 43-019-31404
LOCATION: 1/4,1/4 NWNW Sec: 9 TWP: 21S RNG: 19E 470 FNL 1320 FWL

Geology/Ground Water:

MSC plans to set 500 feet of surface casing in the proposed well. The surface formation at this location is the
Mancos Shale. The Mancos is not known to be a prolific aquifer but records indicate that water is present in
some zones of the Mancos. There are 4 water wells within a 10,000 foot radius of the proposed location. One
well is owned by a private individual. This well is over a mile from the proposed well. The well is
approximately 100 feet deep and is listed for domestic use and stock watering. The remaining 3 wells are also
over a mile from the proposed location. These wells are owned by SITLA and are listed as mining/industrial
use. These wells are over 2,000 feet deep and probably produce from the Dakota Sandstone. The proposed
casing and cementing program should adequately protect any useable ground water in this area.

Reviewer: Brad Hill Date: 06-15-04

Surface:

Proposed location is ~2 miles east of Crescent Junction on I-70 and ~5 miles west of Thompson Springs, Utah.
Staked location lies north of Interstate 70 and south of the old highway between Crescent Junction and Thompson
Springs. Access to the proposed site is off of the old highway. Approximately 1160' of new access will be built to
access this well. The direct area drains to the south. DWR, SITLA, and Grand County were all invited to attend the
pre-drill meeting for this well- none of whom chose to attend. DWR submitted written comments with no wildlife
issues for this well.

Reviewer: Mark L. Jones Date: June 7, 2004

Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill:

1. A 12 mil. minimum thickness liner will be optional lining the reserve pit.
2. Berm the location on 4
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STATE OF UTAH, DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS Page 1 of 3

Search Utah.gov

UTAH DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS

WRPLAT Program Output Listing

Version: 2004.03.26.00 Rundate: 06/15/2004 09:03 AM

Radius search of 10000 feet from a point S470 E1320 from the NW corner, section 35, Township 21S, Range 19E, SL b&m
/ Criteria:wrtypes=W,C,E podtypes=U status=U,A,P usetypes=all

http://utstnrwrt6.waterrights.utah.gov/cgi-bin/mapserv.exe

STATE OF UTAH, DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS Page 1 of 3

Search Utah.gov

UTAH DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS

WRPLAT Program Output Listing

Version: 2004.03.26.00 Rundate: 06/15/2004 09:03 AM

Radius search of 10000 feet from a point S470 E1320 from the NW corner, section 35, Township 21S, Range 19E, SL b&m
/ Criteria:wrtypes=W,C,E podtypes=U status=U,A,P usetypes=all

http://utstnrwrt6.waterrights.utah.gov/cgi-bin/mapserv.exe



STATE OF UTAH, DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS Page 2 of 3

21 22 23 24

28 27 26 E
30

I

2-33(

2-33 2-33C

3 2 1 6

o 1300 2600 3900 5200 ft

http://utstnrwrt6.waterrights.utah.gov/cgi-bin/mapserv.exe

STATE OF UTAH, DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS Page 2 of 3

21 22 23 24

28 27 26 E
30

I

2-33(

2-33 2-33C

3 2 1 6

o 1300 2600 3900 5200 ft

http://utstnrwrt6.waterrights.utah.gov/cgi-bin/mapserv.exe



STATE OF UTAH, DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS Page 3 of 3

Water Rights

WR Diversion Well Status Priority Uses CFS ACFT Owner NameNumber Type/Location Log
92-32 Underground P 19530122 DIS 0.015 0.000 Erma S. Wimmer

S2186 W230 NE 33 21S
19E SL Thompson UT

Utah School and Institutional92-330 Underground U 19841016 DOX 11.200 8100.000 Trust Lands Admin.
N600 Wl l50 SE 33 21S 675 East 500 South, 5th Floor19E SL

Utah School and Institutional92-330 Underground U 19841016 DOX 11.200 8100.000 Trust Lands Admin.
Sl650 W950 NE 04 22S 675 East 500 South, 5th Floor19E SL

Utah School and Institutional92-330 Underground U 19841016 DOX 11.200 8100.000 Trust Lands Admin.
S800 W2700 NE 04 22S 675 East 500 South, 5th Floor19E SL

Utah School and Institutional92-330 Underground U 19841016 DOX 11.200 8100.000 Trust Lands Admin.
S800 W1150 NE 04 22S 675 East 500 South, 5th Floor

)
19E SL

Natural Resources | Contact | Disclaimer | Privacy Policy | Accessibility Policy

http://utstnrwrt6.waterrights.utah.gov/cgi-bin/mapserv.exe
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STATE ACTIONS
Governor's Office of Planning and Budge

Resource Development Coordinating Committee
P.O. Box 145610

1594 W. North Temple, Suite 3710
SLC, UT 84114-5610

538-5535
1. Administering State Agency 2. Approximate date project will start:

Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210 Upon Approval or June 21, 2004
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

3. Areawide clearinghouse(s) receiving state action: (to be sent out by agency in block 1)

Southeastern Utah Association of Governments

4. Type of action: / / Lease IX / Permit / / License / / Land Acquisition

/ / Land Sale / / Land Exchange / / Other

5. Title of proposed action:

Application for Permit to Drill

6. Description:

MSC Exploration, L.P. proposes to drill the State MSC 35-1 well (wildcat) on State lease ML-47576, Grand County,
Utah. This action is being presented to the RDCC for consideration of resource issues affecting state interests. The
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining is the primary administrative agency in this action and must issue approval before
operations commence.

7. Land affected (site location map required) (indicate county) -- include UTM coordinates where possible
470' FNL 1320' FWL NW/4, NW/4,

Section 35, Township 21 S, Range 19 E, Grand County, Utah

8. Jordan River Natural Areas Forum review - If the proposed action affects lands within the Jordan River Natural
Areas Corridor. N/A

9. Has the local government(s) been contacted? No
If yes,
a. How was contact made?
b. Who was contacted?
c. What was the response?
d. If no response, how is the local government(s) likely to be impacted?

10. Possible significant impacts likely to occur:

Degree of impact is based on the discovery of oil or gas in commercial quantities.

11. Name and phone of district representative from your agency near project site, if applicable:
N/A

12. For further information, contact: . I ature and title of authorized officer

Diana Whitney John R. Baza, Associa Director
Phone: (801) 538-5312

,
ate: June 8,
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MICHAEL O. LEAVITT
Governor

OLENE S. WALKER
Lieutenant Governor

The State of Utah 22 June, 2004

Department of
Natural Resources Carolyn Wright

Department of Natural Resources
Division of Center for Policy and Planning

Wildlife Resources 1594 West North Temple, Suite 3710
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5610

ROBERT L MORGAN
Executive Director

KEVIN K. CONWAY
Division Director

Subject: RDCC # 4120, APD MSC 35-1

Dear Ms. Wright;

In regards to the subject action, the Utah Division of Wildlife Resources has the
following comments.

This area may contain active white-tailed prairie dog (a state species of concern) colonies
which provide habitat for associated species such as the burrowing owl, also a state
species of concern. Two Utah rare plants, Cisco milk vetch and Canyonlands lomatium
are known to occur nearby. Development-related activities could negatively impact these
animal and plant species.

We recommend that the area be surveyed for sensitive species prior to construction of the
well pad and access road. These facilities should be located where they do not destroy
occupied habitat. If a power supply is necessary, no power poles should be installed
within prairie dog colonies.

Thank-you for the opportunity to review and comment on this proposed action. If you
have any questions, please contact Tony Wright, oil and gas mitigation biologist, at our
Price office, (435) 636-0267.

Sincere ,

Derris Jones
Regional Supervisor

Southeastern Region•475 West Price River Drive, Suite C, Price, UT 84501-2860 3 *

telephone (435) 636-0260 •facsimile (435) 637-7361• www.wildlife utah.gov Where ideas
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Well name: 06-04 MSC State 35-1
operator: MSC Exploration LP
String type: Surface Project ID:

43-019-31404
Location: Grand County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 72 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 200 ft

Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface

intrs_t
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 203 psi
Intemal gradient: 0.468 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 436 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 7,800 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 9.500 ppg
Neutral point: 437 ft Next setting BHP: 3,849 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 500 ft
Injection pressure 500 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (In) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft*)
1 500 ' 8.625 - 24.00 ~' K-55 ' ST&C "

500 500 7.972 24.1

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (KIps) (Kips) Factor
1 218 1370 6.284 - 436 2950 6.76 ' 12 263 21.93 J '

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Phone: 801-538-5281 Date: June 29,2004
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining FAX: 801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 500 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for terision.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineedng responsibility for use of thisdesign wi/Ibe thatof the
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pressure: 203 psi
Intemal gradient: 0.468 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 436 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 7,800 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 9.500 ppg
Neutral point: 437 ft Next setting BHP: 3,849 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 500 ft
Injection pressure 500 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (In) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft*)
1 500 ' 8.625 - 24.00 ~' K-55 ' ST&C "

500 500 7.972 24.1

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (KIps) (Kips) Factor
1 218 1370 6.284 - 436 2950 6.76 ' 12 263 21.93 J '

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Phone: 801-538-5281 Date: June 29,2004
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining FAX: 801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 500 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for terision.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineedng responsibility for use of thisdesign wi/Ibe thatof the



Well name: 06-04 MSC State 35-1
operator: MSC Exploration LP
String type: Production Project ID:

43-019-31404
Location: Grand County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collaose Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 9.500 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 174 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 368 ft

Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 2,455 ft

Max anticipated surface
pressure: 200 psi

Internal gradient: 0.468 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 3,849 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 6,676 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft*)
1 7800 - 5.5 17.00 - N-80 - LT&C 7800 7800 4.767 268.8

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (KIps) Factor
1 3849 6290 1.634 ~ 3849 7740 2.01

^

133 348 2.62 J
'

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Phone: 801-538-5281 Date: June 29,2004
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining FAX: 801-359-3940 Salt Lake City,Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 7800 ft, a mud weight of 9.5 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design willbe thatof the
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Body yield: 1.50 (B)
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Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity
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TIDEWATER OIL & GAs COMPANY LLC
11614 Elk Head Range Road Littleton, Colorado 80202 (303) 468-0656

6/26/04

Ms. Diana Whitney
State Of Utah Oil, Gas & Mining
1594 W. N. Temple Ste 1210
Salt Lake City, UT 84114

RE: MSC Exploration, L.P. Designation of Operator for T21S Rl9E Sec. 35 All

Ms. Whitney,

Please find the attached sign Designation of Agent or Operator form for the subject
section. If you have any questions I can be reached at (303) 468-0656.

Sincerely,
TIDEW ER OIL & GAS COMPANY LLC

J s Jones, anager

RECEIVED
JUN2 9 2004

DIV.0F016GAS&

TIDEWATER OIL & GAs COMPANY LLC
11614 Elk Head Range Road Littleton, Colorado 80202 (303) 468-0656

6/26/04

Ms. Diana Whitney
State Of Utah Oil, Gas & Mining
1594 W. N. Temple Ste 1210
Salt Lake City, UT 84114

RE: MSC Exploration, L.P. Designation of Operator for T21S Rl9E Sec. 35 All

Ms. Whitney,

Please find the attached sign Designation of Agent or Operator form for the subject
section. If you have any questions I can be reached at (303) 468-0656.

Sincerely,
TIDEW ER OIL & GAS COMPANY LLC

J s Jones, anager

RECEIVED
JUN2 9 2004

DIV.0F016GAS&



STATE OF UTAH FORM 5
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

DESIGNATION OF AGENT OR OPERATOR

The undersigned is, on record, the holder of oil and gas lease

LEASE NAME: c no so e.ohn

LEASE NUMBER: 6 1 6 1 A:

and hereby designates

citY 40 o state 'Ty zip T) q 90

as his (check one) agent O / operator 0, with full authority to act in his behalf in complying with the terms of the lease and
regulations applicable theretoand on whom the Division Director or Authorized Agent may serve written or oral instructions in
securing compliance with the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules and Pmcedural Rules of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining
of the State of Utah with respect to:

(Describe acreage to whichthisdesignation is applicable. Identify each oiland gas well by API number and name. Attach additional pages as
needed.)

RECEIVED
JUN2 9 2304

nlvnr nli GAu MININtì

It is understood that this designation ofagent/operatordoes not relieve the lessee ofresponsibility for compliance with the terms
of the lease and the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules and Procedural Rules of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining of the
State of Utah. It is also understood that this designation of agent or operator does not constitute an assignment of any interest in
the lease.

In case ofdefault on the part ofthedesignated agent/operator, the lessee willmakefulland prompt compliance withallrules, lease
terms or orders of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining of the State of Utah or its authorized representative.

The lessee agrees to promptly notifythe DivisionDirector or Authorized Agent of any change in this designation.

Effective Date of Designation: -

,9.,9 q¾

BY: (Name) a vm onei OF: (company) cks O 45 Co· R
(Signature) (Address) i I $ $$ Sk

. N .

(Title) citY

(Phone) O - \ S state q zip 4 \
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 5
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

DESIGNATION OF AGENTOR OPERATOR * ' 3" '"°

The undersigned is, on record, the holder of oil and gas lease

LEASE NAME: oc ogte t Á«OÑ eA.

LEASE NUMBER: 1 5 3

and hereby designates

citY År, a state Ty zip 11o kO

as his (check one) agent O / operator 0, with full authority to act in his behalf in complying with the terms of the lease and
regulations applicable thereto and on whom the Division Director or Authorized Agent may serve written or oral instructions in
securing compliance withthe Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules and Procedural Rules of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining
of the State of Utah with respect to:

(Describe acreage towhich this designation is applicable. Identify each oil and gas wellby API number and name. Attach additional pages as
needed.)

RECEIVED
JUN2 9

DNOFOIL,GASAMINING
It is understood that thisdesignation of agent/operator does not relieve the lessee of responsibility for compliance withthe terms
of the lease and the Oiland Gas Conservation General Rules and Procedural Rules ofthe Board ofOil, Gas and Miningofthe
State of Utah. It is also understood that this designation of agent or operator does not constitute an assignment of any interest in
the lease.

In case of default on the part ofthe designated agent/operator, the lessee willmake fulland prompt compliance withallrules, lease
terms or orders of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining of the State of Utah or its authorized representative.

The lessee agrees to promptly notifythe Division Director or Authorized Agent of any change in this designation.

Effective Date of Designation: 5-a.2 -o 4

BY: ag

ature)

OF: ( rnpany)

(Title) \ Å,go city o en
(Phone) - gio 6 - ( 3 OO state zip pg (S~Û
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regulations applicable thereto and on whom the Division Director or Authorized Agent may serve written or oral instructions in
securing compliance withthe Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules and Procedural Rules of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining
of the State of Utah with respect to:

(Describe acreage towhich this designation is applicable. Identify each oil and gas wellby API number and name. Attach additional pages as
needed.)

RECEIVED
JUN2 9

DNOFOIL,GASAMINING
It is understood that thisdesignation of agent/operator does not relieve the lessee of responsibility for compliance withthe terms
of the lease and the Oiland Gas Conservation General Rules and Procedural Rules ofthe Board ofOil, Gas and Miningofthe
State of Utah. It is also understood that this designation of agent or operator does not constitute an assignment of any interest in
the lease.

In case of default on the part ofthe designated agent/operator, the lessee willmake fulland prompt compliance withallrules, lease
terms or orders of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining of the State of Utah or its authorized representative.
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Diana Whitney - Well Clearance Page 1

From: Ed Bonner
To: Whitney, Diana
Date: 7/19/2004 3:05:00 PM
Subject: Well Clearance

The following wells have been given cultural resource clearance by the Trust Lands Cultural Resources
Group:

CDX Rockies, LLC
Atchee Canyon State 36-12-25 #1

MSC Exploration LP
State MSC 35-1

Westport Oil & Gas Company
North Bench State 24-18
State 1022-36E

Dominion Exploration & Production, Inc
LCU 10-2H (2 sites in access road on BLM land which must be advoided)

Ifyou have any questions regarding thismatter please give me a call.

CC: Garrison, LaVonne; Hill,Brad; Hunt,
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OLENE S. WALKER
Governor

GAYLE F.McKEACHNIE
Lieutenant Governor

State Utah July 15, 2004

Department of
Natural Resources

ROBERT L. MORGAN MSC Exploration, L.P.ExecutiveDirector
16800 Imperial Valley Drive, Suite 380

Division of Houston, Texas 77060
Oil, Gas & Mining

LOWELL P.BRAXTON
Division airector Re: State MSC 35-1 Well, 470' FNL, 1320' FWL, NW NW, Sec. 35, T. 21 South,

R. 19 East, Grand County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

Appropriate information has been submitted to DOGM and administrative
approval of the requested exception location is hereby granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-019-31404.

ely,

ohn R. Baza
Associate Director

jc
Enclosures

cc: Grand County Assessor
SITLA

f
1594WestNorth Temple, Suite 1210,PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340•facsimile (801) 359-3940•TTY (801) 538-7458 •www.ogm.utah.gov Where ideas
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Operator: MSC Exploration, L.P.
Well Name & Number State MSC 35-1

API Number: 43-019-31404
Lease: ML-47576

Location: NW NW Sec. 35 T. 21 South R. 19 East

Conditions of Approval
1. General

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following
actions during drilling of this well:

• 24 hours prior to cementing or testing casing
• 24 hours prior to testing blowout prevention equipment
• 24 hours prior to spudding the well
• within 24 hours of any emergency changes made to the approved drilling program
• prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well

The following are Division of Oil, Gas and Mining contacts and their work telephone
numbers (please leave a voice mail message if the person is not available to take the call):

• Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338
• Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284 (spud)

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. Compliance with the State of Utah Antiquities Act forbids disturbance of archeological,
historical, or paleontological remains. Should archeological, historical or paleontological
remains be encountered during your operations, you are required to immediately suspend
all operations and immediately inform the Trust Lands Administration and the Division
of State History of the discovery of such remains.

5. Compliance with the Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill outlined in
the Statement of Basis. (Copy

Operator: MSC Exploration, L.P.
Well Name & Number State MSC 35-1

API Number: 43-019-31404
Lease: ML-47576

Location: NW NW Sec. 35 T. 21 South R. 19 East
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6. This proposed well is located in an area for which drillingunits (well spacing patterns)
have not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the
"Board"). In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the
operator is requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to
analyze geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data
from surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its
analysis, and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon
which the well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate
order from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such
analysis by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.

7. Production casing cement should be brought above Dakota Sandstone (±
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"Board"). In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the
operator is requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to
analyze geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data
from surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its
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which the well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate
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analysis by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.

7. Production casing cement should be brought above Dakota Sandstone (±



00 6
CONFilENTIR

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORNIATION

Name of Company: MSC EXPLORATION LP

Well Name: STATE MSC 35-1

Api No: 43-019-31404 Lease Type: STATE

Section 35 Township 21S Range 19E County GRAND

Drilling Contractor BOB BEAMAN RIG # RATHOLE

SPUDDED:
Date 07/27/04

Time

How DRY

Drilling will commence:

Reported by GAYLIN WILLIAMS

Telephone #

Date 07/28/2004 Signed
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MSC EXPLORATION, LP
16800 IMPERIAL VALLEY DRIVE

SUITE 380
HOUSTON, TEXAS 77060

281-931-8933 &281-931-8655FAX

FACSIMILE TRANSMITTAL SHEET

TO PROM:

Et1MPANY DATE

FAX NU ER: TOTAL N OF PAGES INCLUDING COVER:l- STA 3140
PHONE NUMBIIR:

RI

O unorrrr O FOR REVIEW PLEASE COMMRNT PLßASE REPLY PLEASE RECYCl.li

NOTES/COMMITNTS:

RECEIVED
JUL28 2M
OFOIL,GAS&
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CONFilEN1lAL
Tot as4 sewo

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GASANDMINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS & IF - AOREEL CRTRIGEMME

7. UNIT w CAAGREEMENT NAME:Do not use iMsformfor pmposals © ddllnewwalk algniicanlly deepen edelingweis below cmrant bolonhole depih, teenior plugged Wells, orb
drilhodzonild IMarais. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLformforauch pmposals.

1. TYPEOF WELL -- 8 ELL and NUMBEROIL WELL |__| GAS WELL Oll lER

3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR PHONENUMBElt 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:

4 LOCATiONOFWŒLL

roorAGEGATSURFACE: µO . 94() COUNTY: O-
OWOOTR,SECTION. TOWNSHIP.RANGE,MERIDIAN: STATE:

urAN

n. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXESTO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O NOTICEOF im
ACIDizE DEEPEN REPERFORATECURRENT FORMATION

(suintim-> O ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDBACK O REPAR WEU.
Appmdmain dale wom willstat CASINGREPAIR NEWOONSTRUCRON WOW ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUSPLANS OPERATORCHE TUDINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUDING PLUGANDABANDON VENTORFLARE

O SU6SEQUENTREPORT O CHE WELLNAME MM WATER DISPOSA
(SubmitOriginalFona Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS O PRCOUCWN TARTMSUME) WATERBHULOFFDale of wat compiegort

O COMUNGLE PRODUCMGFORIMBONS RECMMARON OF WEU.SHE O ONER

O co--.- RECOMRETE - DWFERENTFORMNDON

11 DESCRIBEPROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS show delails IncI pths. Volumes etc.

RECEIVED
JUL28 2004

DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINING

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) «si- TITLE AlkaA34 fie:t he
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INSTRUCTIONS
This form shall be submitted by the operator to show the Intention andlor completion of the following:
e miscellaneouswork projects and actions for which other specific report forms do not exist;
e all other work and events as identified in section 11, Type of Action, or as required by the Utah Oil and Gas

Conservation General Rules, including:
- minordeepening of an existingwell bore,
- plugging back a well,
- recompleting to a differentproducing formation withinan exlsing wen bore (intent only),
- reperforatingthe current poducing formation,
- driling a sidetrack to repair a well,
- reporting monthly the status of each drBIIngwell.

This fonn is not to be used for oronosalsto
- drillnew wells.
- reenter previously plugged and abandoned wells,
- signincantly deepen existingweHs below their current bollowhole depth,
- dril horizontal laterals from an existing wellbore,
- drillhydrocarbon exploratoryholes such as core samples and stratigraphictests.

Use Form 3. Application for Pennit to Drii (APD) for such proposals.

NOTICEOF INTENT - A notlce of intention to do work on a well or to change plans previously approved shall be
submitted in duplicate and must be moelvedand approvedby the division before thework is commenced. The operator
is responsible for receipt of the notice by the division in ample time for pmper considerationand action. In cases of
emergency,the opemtormayoblainverbalapprovalto commencework. Within fivedays aner receivingverbal approval,
the operator shall submita Sundry Notice describing the work and acknowledging the verbal approval

SUBSEQUENT REPORT - A subsequent report shall be submitted to the division within 30 days of the completionof
the outlined work. Specific details of the work performed should be provided, including dates, wel depths, placement
of plugs, etc.

WELL ABANDONMENT-Proposals toabandon a welland subsequent reportsofabandonment should includereasons
for the abandonment; data on any former or present productive zones, or other zones with present signiiicant fluid
contents not sealedoffby cement or otherwise;depths (topand bottom)and method of placement of cement plugs·
mudor othermaterialplaced below, between and above plugs; amount, size, and method ofparting ofany casing, liner,
or tubingpuHed and the depth to topofany left in the hole; methodof closing top of well; and date wei site conditioned
for inal inspection looking toapprovalof the abandonment.

Inadditionto any SundryNoticeforms submitted,Form 8, Well Completion or Recompletion Repostand Log must
be submittedto the dMaion to report the Iggg[tmof the folowing operations:
• completingor plugging a new well,
e reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well,
• signincantlydeepening an existingwellbore below the current bottom-hole depth,
• drillinghorizontal laterals froman exlstingwellbore,
• drilling hydrocarbon exploratoryholes such as core samples and stratigraphictests,
• recompletingto a different producing formation.

Send to:

Utah Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suile 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-3543940
Salt Lake City, Utah

INSTRUCTIONS
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e miscellaneouswork projects and actions for which other specific report forms do not exist;
e all other work and events as identified in section 11, Type of Action, or as required by the Utah Oil and Gas
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- reperforatingthe current poducing formation,
- driling a sidetrack to repair a well,
- reporting monthly the status of each drBIIngwell.

This fonn is not to be used for oronosalsto
- drillnew wells.
- reenter previously plugged and abandoned wells,
- signincantly deepen existingweHs below their current bollowhole depth,
- dril horizontal laterals from an existing wellbore,
- drillhydrocarbon exploratoryholes such as core samples and stratigraphictests.

Use Form 3. Application for Pennit to Drii (APD) for such proposals.

NOTICEOF INTENT - A notlce of intention to do work on a well or to change plans previously approved shall be
submitted in duplicate and must be moelvedand approvedby the division before thework is commenced. The operator
is responsible for receipt of the notice by the division in ample time for pmper considerationand action. In cases of
emergency,the opemtormayoblainverbalapprovalto commencework. Within fivedays aner receivingverbal approval,
the operator shall submita Sundry Notice describing the work and acknowledging the verbal approval

SUBSEQUENT REPORT - A subsequent report shall be submitted to the division within 30 days of the completionof
the outlined work. Specific details of the work performed should be provided, including dates, wel depths, placement
of plugs, etc.

WELL ABANDONMENT-Proposals toabandon a welland subsequent reportsofabandonment should includereasons
for the abandonment; data on any former or present productive zones, or other zones with present signiiicant fluid
contents not sealedoffby cement or otherwise;depths (topand bottom)and method of placement of cement plugs·
mudor othermaterialplaced below, between and above plugs; amount, size, and method ofparting ofany casing, liner,
or tubingpuHed and the depth to topofany left in the hole; methodof closing top of well; and date wei site conditioned
for inal inspection looking toapprovalof the abandonment.

Inadditionto any SundryNoticeforms submitted,Form 8, Well Completion or Recompletion Repostand Log must
be submittedto the dMaion to report the Iggg[tmof the folowing operations:
• completingor plugging a new well,
e reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well,
• signincantlydeepening an existingwellbore below the current bottom-hole depth,
• drillinghorizontal laterals froman exlstingwellbore,
• drilling hydrocarbon exploratoryholes such as core samples and stratigraphictests,
• recompletingto a different producing formation.

Send to:

Utah Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suile 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-3543940
Salt Lake City, Utah
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Well name: 06-0ÀMSC State 35-1
operator: MSC Exploration LP
String type: Production Pro|ect ID:

43-019-31404
Location: Grand County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 9.500 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F

Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 184 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 368 ft

.s. urgta
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 3,156 ft

Max anticipated surface
pressure: 218 psi

Intemal gradient: 0.468 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 4,195 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buuress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 7,276 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (In) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (In) (ft')
1 8500 5.5 17.00 N-80 LT&C 8500 8500 4.767 292.9

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (KIps) Factor
1 4195 6290 1.499 4195 7740 1.85 145 348 2.41 J

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Phone: 801-538-5281 Date: July 28,2004
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining FAX: 801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 8500 ft, a mud weight of 9.5 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on theWestcott, Dunlop &Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of thisdesign wi/Ibe thatof the
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Aug 12 04 11:30a MSC EMPLORATION, LP 281 931 8655 p.1

STATEOF UTAH FORM6
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DivisloN OF OIL,GASANDMINING

ENTITYACTIONFORM

Operator YY3*i(' I-X P L.o .ATaa A3 , LŸ OperatorAccountNumber N R$¶S

state Tv-x a a zip n, co o Phone Number: c'221 -'î&BS'i 33

woni
API Number Well Name GO Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current EntRy New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number ERective Date

Comments: "I"" CONFllENTIAL
weilAPI

Number Well Name GG Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number EWectiveDate

Comments:

M Number Weil Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current EntRy New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number EWectiveDate

Comments:

Post-It" Fax Note 7671 Date y

-N\x Ñ G Name Pring

USS CL.Lc.

ED
AUGI 2 2004
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6 6 9
STATEOF UTAH FORM O

DEPARTMElff OF NATURAL.RESOURCES
DMSION OF OIL,GAS ANDMINING

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS
IFINDIAN,AŒØrTEECRTREENAME.

7. UNif ar CAAGREEMENTNAME
Donot usesiisformer piopossab km new wals, algnliinanigdespen emisingwalla belem cumenthallarn4tois depit, reenter plugged weis,orto

ddi boltramaileurala APPt.ICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRI
1. TYPEOF WER -- 8. WEU.tWME and NUMBER

OIL WELL GAS WELL I..J OTHER

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR 0. API NUMBER:

3. ADDRESSOF OPE PHONENUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:

A LOCADONOF WEi.L 33
FOOTAGESATSURFACE COUNTY:

OTROTR, SECTION.TOWNSHIP.RANUR,MERIDIAN: STATE:

n. CHECKA PRIATEBOXESTO IÑDÑTE NATUREOF NOTICE,REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ^cm Ð OEEPEN R1|PERFORATECURRENTFORMATION

O NOTICEOFINTENT
(SubudUn DupicMe) M.TERCA$lNG FRACTURETREAT SOETRACKTO REMR WEŒ

a.................« CANNGREMR NEWCONSTRUCTON MORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETOMOUSPu•• O o-one- Tu.......

O CHANGETUMNG RUG ANDAB- WNT OR W

O SUBSEQUENTREPORT Q C--- O RUG BACK WATER O POSAL
(edinsonginalFenn only)

O CHANGEWE STATUS PRODUCOON(ST UME) WATERSHUT-OPP
Dale ofwork cornpisilort

O co-carmoeue• -=n• 0 RECMMATIONOFWEU.SWE ONER:

O COMRT WER TYPE RECCHTE - DIFFERENT mnON

DESCRIBEPROPOSEO OR COMPLETEDOPERAT10NS. Cimmlyshow all postent detals Iriciudirigd-Ins, depihe, volumes.

Approved by the i RECE\VED
Utah Division ofoil,Gas and Mining SEPg i 20ASENT PSFATOR

et' Date: -Ô
g OFOLGAS&WN\NG

NAME(PLEASEPRIND (\ TITLE A.4 y
*

SIGNATURE DATE

tm........, s.........in

i ) (See instrucians onReverse
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STATEOF UTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

10 1 DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS ANDMINING 5. ŒASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER
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(SubmitOriginalFun Only)
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Date of workcomplenun:
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12. DESCRIBEPROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS. Cleedy shaw all per Inentdetails Includingdates, depths, volurnas, etc

RECEIVED
SEP16 2004

DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINING

consam10tim10a

I?w r

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) TITLE 1 1 * ^ f I

SIGNATURE ... DATE " /ff

(5/2000) (See Insbucions en Reverse Side)

2'd 9998 186 182 dl 'NOIlUNOldX3 3SW ¿CS•€O 90 SI
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Well name 06-04 MSC State 35-1rev. 9-04
Operator: MSC Exploration LP
String type: Production Project ID:

43-019-31404
Location: Grand County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 9.500 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F

Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 220 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 368 ft

Burst:
n factor 1.00 Cement top: 5,755 ft

Burst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 285 psi
Internal gradient: 0.468 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 5,478 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 9,501 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft3)

1 11100 5.5 17.00 N-80 LT&C 11100 11100 4.767 382.5

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 5478 6290 1.148 5478 7740 1.41 189 348 1.84 J

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Phone: 801-538-5281 Date: January 6,2005
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining FAX: 801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 11100 ft, a mud weight of 9.5 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design wi/Ibe thatof the
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Neutral point: 9,501 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft3)

1 11100 5.5 17.00 N-80 LT&C 11100 11100 4.767 382.5

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 5478 6290 1.148 5478 7740 1.41 189 348 1.84 J

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Phone: 801-538-5281 Date: January 6,2005
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining FAX: 801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 11100 ft, a mud weight of 9.5 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design wi/Ibe thatof the



PPI e MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease and WellNo. ContractRio D.RL D.Fji Date on Location Soud Date ReoortDate

E CrestedJuctionWildcaÑ¾imleMSCÈÛUnion#7 Juf24.2004

MD TR Egotage AS AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representative

$827,000 SþQ0
Present Operation Rig Phone: Toolousher

Building Location Rig Fax: David Wilcox

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: |_j Yes LJ No LCSO Sample Date Operator KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date Water Depth it

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes UNo Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jis. Run Settni Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Surface

B1T, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HYDRAULICS RE* ORD
BlT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt RO1 Wt Torque

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM

.--.. . .-.. .,..
99.6...

. .- ...........
.... . .

.

1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 14 x 5.5 4 37 3/4

BHA
Length: Description:

Smpi FL
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pli #1 #2 Desand Cent

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SU IVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE Direction Coordinates VS DL CLOSURE

OPËkATIONSSU 1MAÑY
AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0600 Building location and digging reserve pit. Time Si mmary
Activg Daily Cum.

1. MoblDeMob
2. Cement
3. Circulate

4. Directional Work
5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing

8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U./ N.D.

12. P.U.lL.D. BHA

13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. RIU; R/D
15. Rig Repair
16. Run Casing
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips

.
22. Tst. BOPs

26. Well Control

DIV.0FOLUANAMIMNG
c

Total
Total lours

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious Cost $3,500
Daily Daily Gals Cement: Ex ailyCost $1,000
Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx um. Cost $4,500

T'd/5 A lfES

PPI e MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease and WellNo. ContractRio D.RL D.Fji Date on Location Soud Date ReoortDate

E CrestedJuctionWildcaÑ¾imleMSCÈÛUnion#7 Juf24.2004

MD TR Egotage AS AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representative

$827,000 SþQ0
Present Operation Rig Phone: Toolousher

Building Location Rig Fax: David Wilcox

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: |_j Yes LJ No LCSO Sample Date Operator KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date Water Depth it

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes UNo Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jis. Run Settni Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Surface

B1T, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HYDRAULICS RE* ORD
BlT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt RO1 Wt Torque

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM

.--.. . .-.. .,..
99.6...

. .- ...........
.... . .

.

1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 14 x 5.5 4 37 3/4

BHA
Length: Description:

Smpi FL
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pli #1 #2 Desand Cent

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SU IVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE Direction Coordinates VS DL CLOSURE

OPËkATIONSSU 1MAÑY
AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0600 Building location and digging reserve pit. Time Si mmary
Activg Daily Cum.

1. MoblDeMob
2. Cement
3. Circulate

4. Directional Work
5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing

8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U./ N.D.

12. P.U.lL.D. BHA

13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. RIU; R/D
15. Rig Repair
16. Run Casing
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips

.
22. Tst. BOPs

26. Well Control

DIV.0FOLUANAMIMNG
c

Total
Total lours

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious Cost $3,500
Daily Daily Gals Cement: Ex ailyCost $1,000
Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx um. Cost $4,500

T'd/5 A lfES



PPI MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Rock Lease and Well No. Contract Rio DOL OFS Date on Location Spud Date Report Date

E Crested Jaction W [dcat -State MSC #35-1 tJoion #7 Jul 24, 2004

MD TVD Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative

$827.000 8.500'
Present Operation Rig Phone

Building Location Rig Fax Oavid Wilcox

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc. Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind L I Yes No LCSO Samole Date Operator KB 15 ft

Seas Problem? Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date ater Depth ft

Sky No Pass? AYes No Service KB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt Grade Conn. Jts Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff9

S

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HYD
BIT Bit Type at Avg Grade

No Size Manufactu ROP Tooth Bearing

Bit Remarks ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Str SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 Pump #3

Length Descrpto

MUD DATA

P1T
WT VIS MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

Mud Company

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SU IVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE Direction Coordinates | VS DL CLOSURE

1 I

OPERATIONS SUMMARY
TIME Time Boats Suppiy Boat Name Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0600 Building location and digging reserve pit. Time St mmary
Activity Daily Cum.

1. Mob/DeMob

2. Cement
3. Circulate
4. Directional Work

5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe
7. FisNog

8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.

10. Drill Cmt.lLOT

11. N.U./ N.D.

12. P U./L.D. BHA
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe

14. R/U; RID
15. Rip Repair

16. Run Casing

17. Service Rig

18. Sidetrack Op.

19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey

21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs

DEC1 3 2 04
4 W W

Ream
26. Well Control

(,i ,,.
, ___ 27.WOC

Là . \ IL Q 28.Other

Total
Total Hours

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulk Material on Board Previous Cost $3,500

Daily Daily Gals ement: sx Daily Cost $1,000
Cum. Cum Gais arite sx Cum. Cost

PPI MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Rock Lease and Well No. Contract Rio DOL OFS Date on Location Spud Date Report Date

E Crested Jaction W [dcat -State MSC #35-1 tJoion #7 Jul 24, 2004

MD TVD Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative

$827.000 8.500'
Present Operation Rig Phone

Building Location Rig Fax Oavid Wilcox

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc. Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind L I Yes No LCSO Samole Date Operator KB 15 ft

Seas Problem? Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date ater Depth ft

Sky No Pass? AYes No Service KB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt Grade Conn. Jts Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff9

S

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HYD
BIT Bit Type at Avg Grade

No Size Manufactu ROP Tooth Bearing

Bit Remarks ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Str SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 Pump #3

Length Descrpto

MUD DATA

P1T
WT VIS MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

Mud Company

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SU IVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE Direction Coordinates | VS DL CLOSURE

1 I

OPERATIONS SUMMARY
TIME Time Boats Suppiy Boat Name Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0600 Building location and digging reserve pit. Time St mmary
Activity Daily Cum.

1. Mob/DeMob

2. Cement
3. Circulate
4. Directional Work

5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe
7. FisNog

8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.

10. Drill Cmt.lLOT

11. N.U./ N.D.

12. P U./L.D. BHA
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe

14. R/U; RID
15. Rip Repair

16. Run Casing

17. Service Rig

18. Sidetrack Op.

19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey

21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs

DEC1 3 2 04
4 W W

Ream
26. Well Control

(,i ,,.
, ___ 27.WOC

Là . \ IL Q 28.Other

Total
Total Hours

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulk Material on Board Previous Cost $3,500

Daily Daily Gals ement: sx Daily Cost $1,000
Cum. Cum Gais arite sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration- no ' Daily Drilling Report
BIOck. Lease and Well No. Contract Rio QQL RES Date on Location Soud Date Recott Date

E crestedJuction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union 87 Jul23, 2004

gQ Tyg Egggggg & AFE Amount Comnanv Reoresentative
$827,000 8,500'

Present Oneration Rig Phone: TOGIDusher

Building Location Rig Fax: David WilcoxI-Cunent Weather DONR Visit NPDES Peoge on Loc: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind; O Yes O No LCSO Samole Date Operator KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date er Depth ft

Sky: O No Pass? Ü Yes No Service KB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD WL Grade Conn Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakof 7

Surface

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HYDRAULICS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jels De h In Footage Mrs WOB R ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

niiRemarks Cum ROT Hrs PU WI SO WI ROTWI Tor ue

Pump Slow umpPressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S ed SPM Pum #1 Pu #2 Pum #3

DC DP 1/4

1 9x6 3.15 1/2

2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

Smpi Ê.L.
Chialides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PIT and Cent.

#3 #4 DesR Mg CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD VS CLOSURE

OPERAliONS SU 1MARY
IAL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crow Boat Name: Status:

0600 0600 MIRUNeilson Construction. Building location and digging reserve pit. Time St mmary
Activlty Daily Cum.

1. Mob/DeMob
2. Cement
3. Circulate
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Loqqing
9. Lost Cire.
10. DrillCmt.lLOT
11. N.U.IN.D.
12 P.U.lL.D. BHA
13 P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14 RIU; RID
15 Rig Repair
16 Run Casing
17 Service Rig
18 Sidetrack Op.
19 Stuck Pipe
20 Survey
21 Trips
22 Tst. BOPs
23 UR/HO
24. WO.W
25. Wash &Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other

Total
Total ¾urs

Rig Dc.vnlime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious Cost
Daily Daily Gals Cement sx allyCost $3,500
Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx um. Cost

PPI MSC Exploration- no ' Daily Drilling Report
BIOck. Lease and Well No. Contract Rio QQL RES Date on Location Soud Date Recott Date

E crestedJuction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union 87 Jul23, 2004

gQ Tyg Egggggg & AFE Amount Comnanv Reoresentative
$827,000 8,500'

Present Oneration Rig Phone: TOGIDusher

Building Location Rig Fax: David WilcoxI-Cunent Weather DONR Visit NPDES Peoge on Loc: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind; O Yes O No LCSO Samole Date Operator KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date er Depth ft

Sky: O No Pass? Ü Yes No Service KB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD WL Grade Conn Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakof 7

Surface

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HYDRAULICS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jels De h In Footage Mrs WOB R ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

niiRemarks Cum ROT Hrs PU WI SO WI ROTWI Tor ue

Pump Slow umpPressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S ed SPM Pum #1 Pu #2 Pum #3

DC DP 1/4

1 9x6 3.15 1/2

2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

Smpi Ê.L.
Chialides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PIT and Cent.

#3 #4 DesR Mg CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD VS CLOSURE

OPERAliONS SU 1MARY
IAL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crow Boat Name: Status:

0600 0600 MIRUNeilson Construction. Building location and digging reserve pit. Time St mmary
Activlty Daily Cum.

1. Mob/DeMob
2. Cement
3. Circulate
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Loqqing
9. Lost Cire.
10. DrillCmt.lLOT
11. N.U.IN.D.
12 P.U.lL.D. BHA
13 P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14 RIU; RID
15 Rig Repair
16 Run Casing
17 Service Rig
18 Sidetrack Op.
19 Stuck Pipe
20 Survey
21 Trips
22 Tst. BOPs
23 UR/HO
24. WO.W
25. Wash &Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other

Total
Total ¾urs

Rig Dc.vnlime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious Cost
Daily Daily Gals Cement sx allyCost $3,500
Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx um. Cost



e
PPI MSC Exploration

r Daily Drilling Report
Block ease and WallNo Contráôt Ria QQL Q.Ëg Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

E Ctested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 Jul 26, 2004

m M F_gotage A AFE Arñoont Auth. TD. Company Representative

$827,000 8,500"

Present Operation Rig Phone: Toolpusher

Building location Rig Fax: David Wileox

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No i CSO Sample Date Operator KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor NextBOP Test Date ater Depth 11

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes ONo Service KB-CHF

CASING RECORD
Casing Stäng OO Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD WD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Surface

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HYDRAULICS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Siza Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt RGI Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures

No Stroka X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM #3

aps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

L gth: Descdption:

Smpl EL
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

I #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desill Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD

OPERAT ONS SU.1MARY
AL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0600 Building location and reserve pit. WO pit liner Time Sa mmary
Activity Daily Cum.

1. Mob/DeMob

2. Cement
3. Circulate

4. Directional Work
5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe

7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DriR Cmt./LOT

11. N.U.IN.D.
12. P.U.lL.D. BHA
13. P-U./LD. Pipe
14. R/U; RID
15. Rig Repair
16. Run Casing
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.

25. Wash & Ream
Well Control

Total
Total ¾urs

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Bo s Cost $5,500
Daily Daily Gals Cement éx ost

Cum. Cum. Gais Barite: sx Cum. Cost

e
PPI MSC Exploration

r
Daily Drilling Report

Block ease and WallNo Contráôt Ria QQL Q.Ëg Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

E Ctested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 Jul 26, 2004

m M F_gotage A AFE Arñoont Auth. TD. Company Representative

$827,000 8,500"

Present Operation Rig Phone: Toolpusher

Building location Rig Fax: David Wileox

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No i CSO Sample Date Operator KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor NextBOP Test Date ater Depth 11

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes ONo Service KB-CHF

CASING RECORD
Casing Stäng OO Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD WD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Surface

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HYDRAULICS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Siza Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt RGI Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures

No Stroka X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM #3

aps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

L gth: Descdption:

Smpl EL
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

I #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desill Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD

OPERAT ONS SU.1MARY
AL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0600 Building location and reserve pit. WO pit liner Time Sa mmary
Activity Daily Cum.

1. Mob/DeMob

2. Cement
3. Circulate

4. Directional Work
5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe

7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DriR Cmt./LOT

11. N.U.IN.D.
12. P.U.lL.D. BHA
13. P-U./LD. Pipe
14. R/U; RID
15. Rig Repair
16. Run Casing
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.

25. Wash & Ream
Well Control

Total
Total ¾urs

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Bo s Cost $5,500
Daily Daily Gals Cement éx ost

Cum. Cum. Gais Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI - MSC Exploration- no Daily Drilling Report
Block. Lease and Well No. Contract Rio ûQL DER Date on Location Soud Date Renort Date

E Costed Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 Jul25, 2004

gg Tyg AFE Amount g Comna w Rooresentative

$827,000 8,500'

Present Ooeration Rig Phone: Toolousher

Building Location Rig Fax: David WIcox

Cunent Weather DONR Visit NPDES Peoge on Loc: ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes No LC50 samoleDate Operator RKS 15 A

Seas: Problem7 O Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date Water Depth n
Sky: O No Pass? Ü Yes U No Service RKB-CHF A

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt Grade Conn Jts Run Settins Depth Uner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Surface

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HYDRAULICS RECORD
BIT BIt Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets De h in Fo e Hra WOB R ROP Tooth Beari Ga e

Bit Remarks Cum ROT Hrs PU Wt SO WI ROT Wt T ue
I

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S ed SPM Pum #1 Pu $2 Pum 83

DC DP 1/4

1 9x6 3.15 1/2
2 14 x 5 5 4.37 3/4

BHA
Lengh: Description:

Smpi AL
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engneer Mud Com any

Prl Desand

#3 #4 DeslK Mint ni Dail Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD VS CLOSURE

OPERAVONS SU IMARY
I JIL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0600 Buildinglocation and digging reserve plt. Time Si mmary

Activity Daily Cum
1. Mob/DeMob
2. Cement
3. Circulate
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10 DrillCmt/LOT
11 N.U l N.D.
12 P.U IL D. BHA
13 P.U IL.D. Pipe
14 RIU, RID
15 Rig Repair
16 Run Casing
17 Service Rig
18 Sidetrack Op.
19 StuckPipe
20 Survey
21 Trips
22 Tst. BOPs
23 UR/HO
24 WO.W
25 Wash & Ream
26 Well Control
27 WOC
28 Other

Total
Total lours

Rlg Dc vnlime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revlousCost $4,500
Daily Daily Geis Coment: sx allyCost $1,000
Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx um. Cost

PPI - MSC Exploration- no Daily Drilling Report
Block. Lease and Well No. Contract Rio ûQL DER Date on Location Soud Date Renort Date

E Costed Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 Jul25, 2004

gg Tyg AFE Amount g Comna w Rooresentative

$827,000 8,500'

Present Ooeration Rig Phone: Toolousher

Building Location Rig Fax: David WIcox

Cunent Weather DONR Visit NPDES Peoge on Loc: ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes No LC50 samoleDate Operator RKS 15 A

Seas: Problem7 O Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date Water Depth n
Sky: O No Pass? Ü Yes U No Service RKB-CHF A

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt Grade Conn Jts Run Settins Depth Uner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Surface

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HYDRAULICS RECORD
BIT BIt Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets De h in Fo e Hra WOB R ROP Tooth Beari Ga e

Bit Remarks Cum ROT Hrs PU Wt SO WI ROT Wt T ue
I

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S ed SPM Pum #1 Pu $2 Pum 83

DC DP 1/4

1 9x6 3.15 1/2
2 14 x 5 5 4.37 3/4

BHA
Lengh: Description:

Smpi AL
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engneer Mud Com any

Prl Desand

#3 #4 DeslK Mint ni Dail Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD VS CLOSURE

OPERAVONS SU IMARY
I JIL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0600 Buildinglocation and digging reserve plt. Time Si mmary

Activity Daily Cum
1. Mob/DeMob
2. Cement
3. Circulate
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10 DrillCmt/LOT
11 N.U l N.D.
12 P.U IL D. BHA
13 P.U IL.D. Pipe
14 RIU, RID
15 Rig Repair
16 Run Casing
17 Service Rig
18 Sidetrack Op.
19 StuckPipe
20 Survey
21 Trips
22 Tst. BOPs
23 UR/HO
24 WO.W
25 Wash & Ream
26 Well Control
27 WOC
28 Other

Total
Total lours

Rlg Dc vnlime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revlousCost $4,500
Daily Daily Geis Coment: sx allyCost $1,000
Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx um. Cost



t PPI e MSC Exploration
"$U Daily Drilling Report

Block Lease and WellNo ContractRio QQL Dfg Date on j.ocation Soud Date RenortDate

E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 1 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Juf28, 2004

MR T_VD g AB AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative

35 35 35 $827,000 6,500' Norman Woods

Present Operation Rig Phone: Toolousher

Waiting on jointof 12-3/4" Conductor Rig Fax: Todd Beeman

Current Weather DOÑR Visit NPDES Peopie on Loc : ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind L_lYes U No 1.C50SampieDate Operator KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? L_Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date ter Depth ft

Sky: No Pass7 (__YesjLJNo Service KB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakof?

Conductor
Surface

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEËD AND HIDRAULICS REW ORD
BlT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT WI Torque

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM #3

29._ .- .. . . ...

DC
_

DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 14x55 437 3/4

L gth: Description:

Smpi I L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud company

#1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Deslit Mud CI Daily Cost Cumuladve Cost

l
DIRECTIONAL SU IVEYS

MD TVD ANGLE birection coordnates vs DL CLOSURE

OPERAF ONS SU 1MANY
AL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code CreW Boat Name: Status:

1630 0200 9.5 1 MIRUBob Beeman Rig #31. Spud well at 0200 on 7/28/04. Time St mmary
0200 0500 3.0 5 Airdrilled 17-1/2" hole to 36'. Decided togo 10' deeper than planned. Activity Daily Cum.

0500 0600 1.0 2 WO 10' piece of 12-3/4" conductor pipe. 1. MoblDeMob 9.5 9.5
2. Cement 1 1
3. Circulate

Willgravel road and location today with 2" gravel. 4. Directional Work

New rig, having trouble with fuel. Rig losing power. 5. Drilling 3 3
6. Drive Pipe

Galan Williams notifed Carol Daniels and Mark Jones with Utah DONR 7. Fishing

of impending spud of well. 8. OH Logging

9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U,IN.D.
12. P.U.lL.D. BHA
13. P.U-lL.D. Pipe
14. RIU; R/D
15. Rig Repair

16. Run Casing
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey

24. W.O.W.

. ash & Ream
ell Control

27 WOC

Total 4ours 13Ai

2
13.5 13.5

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulk Material on Board revious Cost $22,500
Daily Daily Gals ement: sx ailyCos! $1,500
Cum. Cum. Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost

t PPI e MSC Exploration
"$U Daily Drilling Report

Block Lease and WellNo ContractRio QQL Dfg Date on j.ocation Soud Date RenortDate

E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 1 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Juf28, 2004

MR T_VD g AB AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative

35 35 35 $827,000 6,500' Norman Woods

Present Operation Rig Phone: Toolousher

Waiting on jointof 12-3/4" Conductor Rig Fax: Todd Beeman

Current Weather DOÑR Visit NPDES Peopie on Loc : ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind L_lYes U No 1.C50SampieDate Operator KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? L_Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date ter Depth ft

Sky: No Pass7 (__YesjLJNo Service KB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakof?

Conductor
Surface

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEËD AND HIDRAULICS REW ORD
BlT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT WI Torque

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM #3

29._ .- .. . . ...

DC
_

DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 14x55 437 3/4

L gth: Description:

Smpi I L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud company

#1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Deslit Mud CI Daily Cost Cumuladve Cost

l
DIRECTIONAL SU IVEYS

MD TVD ANGLE birection coordnates vs DL CLOSURE

OPERAF ONS SU 1MANY
AL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code CreW Boat Name: Status:

1630 0200 9.5 1 MIRUBob Beeman Rig #31. Spud well at 0200 on 7/28/04. Time St mmary
0200 0500 3.0 5 Airdrilled 17-1/2" hole to 36'. Decided togo 10' deeper than planned. Activity Daily Cum.

0500 0600 1.0 2 WO 10' piece of 12-3/4" conductor pipe. 1. MoblDeMob 9.5 9.5
2. Cement 1 1
3. Circulate

Willgravel road and location today with 2" gravel. 4. Directional Work

New rig, having trouble with fuel. Rig losing power. 5. Drilling 3 3
6. Drive Pipe

Galan Williams notifed Carol Daniels and Mark Jones with Utah DONR 7. Fishing

of impending spud of well. 8. OH Logging

9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U,IN.D.
12. P.U.lL.D. BHA
13. P.U-lL.D. Pipe
14. RIU; R/D
15. Rig Repair

16. Run Casing
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey

24. W.O.W.

. ash & Ream
ell Control

27 WOC

Total 4ours 13Ai

2
13.5 13.5

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulk Material on Board revious Cost $22,500
Daily Daily Gals ement: sx ailyCos! $1,500
Cum. Cum. Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Explorationne*A° Daily Drilling Report
Block. Lease and Well No. Contract Ria gg, Of.g Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC 435-1 Union #7 Jul27, 2004

Q R f.ggigga & AFE Amount B Comon iv Reoresentative
$827,000 8,500' Norman Woods

Present Ooeraflon Rig Phone: Toolousher
Wog on location road. WO Rathole Rig Rig Foc Todd Beeman

Current Weather DONR VisK NPDES Peo on Loc Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wnd: O Yes 0 No LC50 Samnie Date Operator KB 15 11
Seas: Problem7 O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date er Depth !!

Sky: U No Pass? Yes No Service B-CHF ft
CABING RECORD

Casing String OD WI Grade Conn Jts Run Selting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT
MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

S

BIT,WEIGHT, SPEED AND HYDRAULICS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets De th In Foot e His WOB R ROP Tooth Beari Ga e

Bit Remarks Cum ROT.Hrs PU W SO W ROTN To ue

Pump Slow Pump Pressums
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S ed SPM Pum $1 Pu #2 Pum #3

DC DP 1/4

gth: Description

Šmpi À.L
Chlorkles Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Com an

I #1 Desand

@3 94 DesR Mud CI Daily cost Cumulative cost
I I

DIREC110NAL SLlVEYB
| MD TVD ANGLE Direcion Coordinales VS DL CLOSURE I

l I I I I
OPERALONS SU IMARY

RE Time Boats: Supply Boal Name: Status:
FROM TO HOUR Code Cmw Boat Name: Status:
0600 0600 Watering and packingon location road. WO Bob Beeman Rathole rig. Time Srmmary

Activity Daily Cum.
1. Mob/DeMob
2. Cement
3. Circulate
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logginq
9. Lost Circ.
10 DrillCmt./LOT
11 N.U./ N.D.
12 P.U.lL.D. BHA
13 P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14 RIU; RID
15 Rig Repair
16 Run Casing
17 Service Rig
18 Sidetrack Op.
19 Stuck Pipo
20 Survey
21 Trips
22 Tst. BOPs
23 UR/HO
24 W.O.W
25 Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Olher

Total
Total dours

Rig Dc vntime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Boald Previous Cost $5,500
Daily Daily Gals cement: sx Daly Cost $17,000
Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

PPI MSC Explorationne*A° Daily Drilling Report
Block. Lease and Well No. Contract Ria gg, Of.g Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC 435-1 Union #7 Jul27, 2004

Q R f.ggigga & AFE Amount B Comon iv Reoresentative
$827,000 8,500' Norman Woods

Present Ooeraflon Rig Phone: Toolousher
Wog on location road. WO Rathole Rig Rig Foc Todd Beeman

Current Weather DONR VisK NPDES Peo on Loc Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wnd: O Yes 0 No LC50 Samnie Date Operator KB 15 11
Seas: Problem7 O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date er Depth !!

Sky: U No Pass? Yes No Service B-CHF ft
CABING RECORD

Casing String OD WI Grade Conn Jts Run Selting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT
MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

S

BIT,WEIGHT, SPEED AND HYDRAULICS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets De th In Foot e His WOB R ROP Tooth Beari Ga e

Bit Remarks Cum ROT.Hrs PU W SO W ROTN To ue

Pump Slow Pump Pressums
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S ed SPM Pum $1 Pu #2 Pum #3

DC DP 1/4

gth: Description

Šmpi À.L
Chlorkles Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Com an

I #1 Desand

@3 94 DesR Mud CI Daily cost Cumulative cost
I I

DIREC110NAL SLlVEYB
| MD TVD ANGLE Direcion Coordinales VS DL CLOSURE I

l I I I I
OPERALONS SU IMARY

RE Time Boats: Supply Boal Name: Status:
FROM TO HOUR Code Cmw Boat Name: Status:
0600 0600 Watering and packingon location road. WO Bob Beeman Rathole rig. Time Srmmary

Activity Daily Cum.
1. Mob/DeMob
2. Cement
3. Circulate
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logginq
9. Lost Circ.
10 DrillCmt./LOT
11 N.U./ N.D.
12 P.U.lL.D. BHA
13 P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14 RIU; RID
15 Rig Repair
16 Run Casing
17 Service Rig
18 Sidetrack Op.
19 Stuck Pipo
20 Survey
21 Trips
22 Tst. BOPs
23 UR/HO
24 W.O.W
25 Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Olher

Total
Total dours

Rig Dc vntime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Boald Previous Cost $5,500
Daily Daily Gals cement: sx Daly Cost $17,000
Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PI MSCExploration '

"e * Daily Drillin Report
Block Unpseand Well No ontrác QL Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat Union #7 3 2 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Jul 30, 2004

MQ R Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative

280 280 245 $827,000 8,500' Norman Woods

Present Queration Rig Phone: Toolousher

DrillingSurface Hole Rig Fax: Todd Beeman

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 1 ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No I CSOSample Date Operator i RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 U Yes contractor ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED ANDHiDRAULICSNELORD

BIT Bit Type and Totál Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

2 12 1/4 Halco Air Hammer Bit 35' 245' 8 3/4 2 10 28.0

BitRemerks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pum #g Pum Pug

gps DC DP 1/4

i 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

LHe
gth: 84' Description: 12.25" air hammer bit (6'), 9.75 stab(17), 3- 6" DC (60')

MUDDATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm PflMf

PIT

SmpI E.L.

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours MudEngineer Mud Company

PfË #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
VS

OPERATONS SUl1MARY

iAL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0800 2.0 28 Installed rig anchors, T&M,Tested to 20,000 #, all anchors have test tag Time St mmary

0800 0830 0.5 14 Install 6" blooie line to pit, Start compressor, CO hole Activity Daily Cum.

0830 1045 2.3 5 Air drilling surface hole. Drilled 20' in 30 min,PU 3rd DC, Drilled 20' in 25 min 1. MoblDeMob 9.5

Installed strippinghead. PU DP. Hydraulicpumpfailed. 2. Cement 1

1045 1230 1.8 15 Repaired hydraulic pump, 3. Circulate

1230 1530 3.0 5 Air drilling surface hole from 82' to 176' 4. Directional Work

1530 1630 1.0 5 Air drilled 31'in 45 min. Depth 207. 5. Drilling 8.75 11.75

1630 1700 0.5 17 Add hydraulic fluid 6. Drive Pipe

1700 1930 2.5 5 Air drilled from 20T to 280' 7. Fishing

1930 0600 10.5 28 Shut down for night 8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U./N.D.
12. P.U.lL.D. BHA 3.5

13. P.U,/L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 0.5 0.5
15. Rig Repair 1.75 5.25

16. Run Casing 2
17. Service Rig 0.5 0.5
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. 80Ps

RECElVED
fiv°.
25. Wash &Ream

DFC 11 2g 26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 12.5 15

l.Ilhb Total 24 61.5

Total dours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $71,750

Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $6,584

Cum Cum. Gals Sarite: sx Cum. Cost

PI MSCExploration '

"e * Daily Drillin Report
Block Unpseand Well No ontrác QL Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat Union #7 3 2 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Jul 30, 2004

MQ R Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative

280 280 245 $827,000 8,500' Norman Woods

Present Queration Rig Phone: Toolousher

DrillingSurface Hole Rig Fax: Todd Beeman

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 1 ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No I CSOSample Date Operator i RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 U Yes contractor ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED ANDHiDRAULICSNELORD

BIT Bit Type and Totál Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

2 12 1/4 Halco Air Hammer Bit 35' 245' 8 3/4 2 10 28.0

BitRemerks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pum #g Pum Pug

gps DC DP 1/4

i 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

LHe
gth: 84' Description: 12.25" air hammer bit (6'), 9.75 stab(17), 3- 6" DC (60')

MUDDATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm PflMf

PIT

SmpI E.L.

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours MudEngineer Mud Company

PfË #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
VS

OPERATONS SUl1MARY

iAL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0800 2.0 28 Installed rig anchors, T&M,Tested to 20,000 #, all anchors have test tag Time St mmary

0800 0830 0.5 14 Install 6" blooie line to pit, Start compressor, CO hole Activity Daily Cum.

0830 1045 2.3 5 Air drilling surface hole. Drilled 20' in 30 min,PU 3rd DC, Drilled 20' in 25 min 1. MoblDeMob 9.5

Installed strippinghead. PU DP. Hydraulicpumpfailed. 2. Cement 1

1045 1230 1.8 15 Repaired hydraulic pump, 3. Circulate

1230 1530 3.0 5 Air drilling surface hole from 82' to 176' 4. Directional Work

1530 1630 1.0 5 Air drilled 31'in 45 min. Depth 207. 5. Drilling 8.75 11.75

1630 1700 0.5 17 Add hydraulic fluid 6. Drive Pipe

1700 1930 2.5 5 Air drilled from 20T to 280' 7. Fishing

1930 0600 10.5 28 Shut down for night 8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U./N.D.
12. P.U.lL.D. BHA 3.5

13. P.U,/L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 0.5 0.5

15. Rig Repair 1.75 5.25

16. Run Casing 2
17. Service Rig 0.5 0.5

18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. 80Ps

RECElVED
fiv°.
25. Wash &Ream

DFC 11 2g 26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 12.5 15

l.Ilhb Total 24 61.5

Total dours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $71,750

Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $6,584

Cum Cum. Gals Sarite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Explorationne Daily Drilling Report
Block. Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria DOL QE Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 2 1 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Jul 29, 2004
TV) Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Compa ty Representative

35 35 $827,000 8,500' Norman Woods
Prêsent Operation Rig Phone: Toolousher

PU BHA & WO Cement Rig Fax: Todd Beeman

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIGELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50 Sample Date Operator KB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date ater Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? U Yes No Service KB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP wd 2 35' 35' Air
Surface

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICS REt ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

qps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2
2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

L gth: Description: 12 25" air hammer bit, 9.75 stab 1- 6"*20' DC

Smpi F.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud CompanyPII #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud Cl Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS

« PERATIONS SUM WARY
TIME Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0830 2.5 28 Waiting on 12-3/4" Conductor pipeto arrive. Time St mmary
0830 1200 3.5 15 Work on rig fuel system. Activity Daily Cum.
1200 1400 2.0 16 PU 10' section of 12-3/4" conductor, weld pipe, Cement wl 19 sx of cement. 1. Mob/DeMob 9.51400 1730 3.5 12 Weld on companion flange. PU 12.25" hammer bit, 9.75" stabilizer & DC 2. Cement 1

installed rotating head. WO cement to set up. SDFN. 3. Circulate
1730 0600 12.5 27 WO Cement to set up. 4. Directional Work

5. Drilling 3
6. Drive Pipe

Placing gravelon location. 7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 3.5 3.5
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. RIU; R/D
15. Rig Repair 3.5 3.5
16. Run Casing 2 2
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5 12.5
28. Other 2.5 2.5

Total 24 37.5Total iours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulkMaterialon Board Previous Cost $24,000Daily Daily Gals ement: sx DailyCost $38,075Cum. Cum. Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost

PPI MSC Explorationne Daily Drilling Report
Block. Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria DOL QE Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 2 1 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Jul 29, 2004
TV) Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Compa ty Representative

35 35 $827,000 8,500' Norman Woods
Prêsent Operation Rig Phone: Toolousher

PU BHA & WO Cement Rig Fax: Todd Beeman

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIGELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50 Sample Date Operator KB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date ater Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? U Yes No Service KB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP wd 2 35' 35' Air
Surface

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICS REt ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

qps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2
2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

L gth: Description: 12 25" air hammer bit, 9.75 stab 1- 6"*20' DC

Smpi F.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud CompanyPII #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud Cl Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS

« PERATIONS SUM WARY
TIME Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0830 2.5 28 Waiting on 12-3/4" Conductor pipeto arrive. Time St mmary
0830 1200 3.5 15 Work on rig fuel system. Activity Daily Cum.
1200 1400 2.0 16 PU 10' section of 12-3/4" conductor, weld pipe, Cement wl 19 sx of cement. 1. Mob/DeMob 9.51400 1730 3.5 12 Weld on companion flange. PU 12.25" hammer bit, 9.75" stabilizer & DC 2. Cement 1

installed rotating head. WO cement to set up. SDFN. 3. Circulate
1730 0600 12.5 27 WO Cement to set up. 4. Directional Work

5. Drilling 3
6. Drive Pipe

Placing gravelon location. 7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 3.5 3.5
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. RIU; R/D
15. Rig Repair 3.5 3.5
16. Run Casing 2 2
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5 12.5
28. Other 2.5 2.5

Total 24 37.5Total iours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulkMaterialon Board Previous Cost $24,000Daily Daily Gals ement: sx DailyCost $38,075Cum. Cum. Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost



MPPI MSC Explorationn Daily Drilling Report
Block |..easeand Well No. Contract Rio a 9.E Date on Location Soud Date Report Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 5 4 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 1, 2004
W Ty_Q Footage AFE No. AFEAmqunt Auth. TD. Company Representative

520 520 $827,000 8,500' Norman Woods
Present Ooeration Rig Phone: Toolousher

MIRU Union RIg #7 Rig Fax:

|Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 1 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: U ves U No LCSO Sample Date Operator i KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? U Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date ater Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass7 U Yes O No Service KB-CHF ft
CASING RECORD

Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT
MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 SIB" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED ANDH/DRAULICSRE( ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

BitRemark;; Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt RO I Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
NO. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pump #3

2 14 x 5 5 4.37 3/4

LHe
gth: 84' Description:

M

smpi I-L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

#1 #2 Desand Cent

#3 #4 Desilt Mud Cl Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

bihÈCTIONALSURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE VS CLOSURE

OPERAT ONS SUtiMARY
i.4E Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0630 0.5 28 Waiting on rig crews Time St mmary
0630 0930 3.0 21 Trip out of hole laying down drilipipe and BHA. Activity Daily Cum.
0930 1000 0.5 16 RU to run Surface casing 1. Mob/DeMob 9.5
1000 1400 4.0 16 Ran 13 jts 8 5/8'" casing with float shoe on bottom. Landed casing @513' 2. Cement 1.5 2.5
1400 1530 1.5 2 Cement with 14 yds (378 cf) of ready mix cement (Type 1, Class A). 3. Circulate 2

Pumping cement @100 psi on casing, dropped plug at 1515 hrs. 4. Directional Work
Plug hit with 300 psi. Held pressure for 4 mins. Released pressure, 5. Drllling 19.25

pressure held. 20 bbis cement returns pumpedto pit. RD cement equipt. 6. Drive Pipe
1530 1630 1.0 14 RD Bob Beeman Rathole rig and moved rig and equipment off location. 7. Fishing
1630 1700 0.5 28 Dig cellararound casing. 8. OH Logging
1700 1845 1.8 28 Weldon CooperCameron 8-5/8" SO x 11", 3Mcasinghead on casing. 9. Lost Circ.

3 passes on outside, 2 passes on inside. Test head to 1000 psi. OK 10. DrillCmt./LOT
SDFN. Waiting on Union Rig #7. 11. N.U./ N.D.

12. P.U.lL.D. BHA 3.5
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe

Shipped 1 t, 42.55' of 8 5/8" casing back to Beeman's yard. 14. R/U;R/D 1 1.5
Willgradelocation and place more graveltoday 15. Rig Repair 6.25
Willinstall 48" culvert for cellar 16. Run Casing 4.5 6.5

17. Service Rip 0.5
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips 3 3
22. Tst. BOPs

RECEIVED
o°.

25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 2.75 31.25

Dv.0FOiL, I dNIÑ.x Total 12.75 98.25
Total lours 12.8

Rig Dcuntime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $80,434
Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $14,462
Cum. 6.3 hrs Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

MPPI MSC Explorationn Daily Drilling Report
Block |..easeand Well No. Contract Rio a 9.E Date on Location Soud Date Report Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 5 4 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 1, 2004
W Ty_Q Footage AFE No. AFEAmqunt Auth. TD. Company Representative

520 520 $827,000 8,500' Norman Woods
Present Ooeration Rig Phone: Toolousher

MIRU Union RIg #7 Rig Fax:

|Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 1 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: U ves U No LCSO Sample Date Operator i KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? U Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date ater Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass7 U Yes O No Service KB-CHF ft
CASING RECORD

Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT
MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 SIB" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED ANDH/DRAULICSRE( ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

BitRemark;; Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt RO I Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
NO. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pump #3

2 14 x 5 5 4.37 3/4

LHe
gth: 84' Description:

M

smpi I-L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

#1 #2 Desand Cent

#3 #4 Desilt Mud Cl Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

bihÈCTIONALSURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE VS CLOSURE

OPERAT ONS SUtiMARY
i.4E Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0630 0.5 28 Waiting on rig crews Time St mmary
0630 0930 3.0 21 Trip out of hole laying down drilipipe and BHA. Activity Daily Cum.
0930 1000 0.5 16 RU to run Surface casing 1. Mob/DeMob 9.5
1000 1400 4.0 16 Ran 13 jts 8 5/8'" casing with float shoe on bottom. Landed casing @513' 2. Cement 1.5 2.5
1400 1530 1.5 2 Cement with 14 yds (378 cf) of ready mix cement (Type 1, Class A). 3. Circulate 2

Pumping cement @100 psi on casing, dropped plug at 1515 hrs. 4. Directional Work
Plug hit with 300 psi. Held pressure for 4 mins. Released pressure, 5. Drllling 19.25

pressure held. 20 bbis cement returns pumpedto pit. RD cement equipt. 6. Drive Pipe
1530 1630 1.0 14 RD Bob Beeman Rathole rig and moved rig and equipment off location. 7. Fishing
1630 1700 0.5 28 Dig cellararound casing. 8. OH Logging
1700 1845 1.8 28 Weldon CooperCameron 8-5/8" SO x 11", 3Mcasinghead on casing. 9. Lost Circ.

3 passes on outside, 2 passes on inside. Test head to 1000 psi. OK 10. DrillCmt./LOT
SDFN. Waiting on Union Rig #7. 11. N.U./ N.D.

12. P.U.lL.D. BHA 3.5
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe

Shipped 1 t, 42.55' of 8 5/8" casing back to Beeman's yard. 14. R/U;R/D 1 1.5
Willgradelocation and place more graveltoday 15. Rig Repair 6.25
Willinstall 48" culvert for cellar 16. Run Casing 4.5 6.5

17. Service Rip 0.5
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips 3 3
22. Tst. BOPs

RECEIVED
o°.

25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 2.75 31.25

Dv.0FOiL, I dNIÑ.x Total 12.75 98.25
Total lours 12.8

Rig Dcuntime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $80,434
Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $14,462
Cum. 6.3 hrs Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPL MSC Exploration
n Daily Drilling Report

Block I ease and Well No. Contract Ria & Date on Location Soud Date Report pate
E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 4 3 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Jul 31, 2004

M Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative

520 520 240 $827,000 8,500' Norman Woods
Present Çppration Rig Phone: Toolousher

Circulate hole to run Surface Casing Rig Fax: Todd Beeman

Current Weather | DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 6 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No LCSOSample Dpte Operator 1 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 U Yes Contractor 5 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H IDRAULICS REt ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total . Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
2 12 1/4 Halco Air Hammer Bit open 35' 485' 16 1/4 2 10 29.8

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt RO I Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM ump #1

GPS DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.1 1/2
2 14 x 5.5 | 4.37 3/4

BHA
Length: 84' Description: 12 25" air hammer bit (6'), 9.75 stab(17'), 3- 6" DC (60')

smpi EL.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PfË #1 #2 Desand Cent

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE CLOSURE

OPERAT ONS SUE1MARY
TiinE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0630 0.5 28 WO rathole rig crew Time St mmary
0630 0700 0.5 15 Start rig and compressor. Repair air line to stinger. Da Cum.
0700 0730 0.5 3 Circulate hole. About 20 bbis of water in hole 1. MoblDeMob 9.5
0730 0830 1.0 5 Air drill 280' to 300'. .33 ft/min 2. Cement 1
0830 0900 0.5 15 Rig repair. Cut off pulley on airline, tied back airlines 3. Circulate 2 2
0900 1100 2.0 5 Air drilling 300' to 362'. .5 ft/min 4. Directional Work
1100 1500 4.0 5 Air drilling362' to 500'. Ran out of water. .58 ft/hr 5. Drilling 7.5 19.25
1500 1600 1.0 28 Waiting on water 6. Drive Pipe
1600 1630 0.5 5 Air drilling500' to 520'. TD for surface casing. 7. Fishing
1630 1645 0.3 3 Circulate &condition hole. 8. OHLogging
1645 1800 1.3 3 Mixing mud. Filling hole wl 8.4 ppg mud. Total 38 bbis. Circ. Hole to pit 9. Lost Circ.
1800 0600 12.0 28 SDFN 10. DrillCmt.lLOT

11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U.lL.D.BHA 3.5
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; RID 0.5
15. Rig Repair 1 6.25
16. Run Casing 2
17. Service Rig 0.5
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 13.5 28.5

Total 24 85.5
Total iours 24.0

Rig DoNntime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $78,334
Daily 1.0 hrs Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $2,100
Cum. 6.3 brs Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

PPL MSC Exploration
n Daily Drilling Report

Block I ease and Well No. Contract Ria & Date on Location Soud Date Report pate
E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 4 3 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Jul 31, 2004

M Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative

520 520 240 $827,000 8,500' Norman Woods
Present Çppration Rig Phone: Toolousher

Circulate hole to run Surface Casing Rig Fax: Todd Beeman

Current Weather | DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 6 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No LCSOSample Dpte Operator 1 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 U Yes Contractor 5 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H IDRAULICS REt ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total . Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
2 12 1/4 Halco Air Hammer Bit open 35' 485' 16 1/4 2 10 29.8

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt RO I Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM ump #1

GPS DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.1 1/2
2 14 x 5.5 | 4.37 3/4

BHA
Length: 84' Description: 12 25" air hammer bit (6'), 9.75 stab(17'), 3- 6" DC (60')

smpi EL.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PfË #1 #2 Desand Cent

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE CLOSURE

OPERAT ONS SUE1MARY
TiinE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0630 0.5 28 WO rathole rig crew Time St mmary
0630 0700 0.5 15 Start rig and compressor. Repair air line to stinger. Da Cum.
0700 0730 0.5 3 Circulate hole. About 20 bbis of water in hole 1. MoblDeMob 9.5
0730 0830 1.0 5 Air drill 280' to 300'. .33 ft/min 2. Cement 1
0830 0900 0.5 15 Rig repair. Cut off pulley on airline, tied back airlines 3. Circulate 2 2
0900 1100 2.0 5 Air drilling 300' to 362'. .5 ft/min 4. Directional Work
1100 1500 4.0 5 Air drilling362' to 500'. Ran out of water. .58 ft/hr 5. Drilling 7.5 19.25
1500 1600 1.0 28 Waiting on water 6. Drive Pipe
1600 1630 0.5 5 Air drilling500' to 520'. TD for surface casing. 7. Fishing
1630 1645 0.3 3 Circulate &condition hole. 8. OHLogging
1645 1800 1.3 3 Mixing mud. Filling hole wl 8.4 ppg mud. Total 38 bbis. Circ. Hole to pit 9. Lost Circ.
1800 0600 12.0 28 SDFN 10. DrillCmt.lLOT

11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U.lL.D.BHA 3.5
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; RID 0.5
15. Rig Repair 1 6.25
16. Run Casing 2
17. Service Rig 0.5
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 13.5 28.5

Total 24 85.5
Total iours 24.0

Rig DoNntime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $78,334
Daily 1.0 hrs Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $2,100
Cum. 6.3 brs Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
no ' Daily Drilling Report

Block. Lease and WellNo. Contract Rio g ggg Date on Location Soud Date Renoit Date

E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 6 5 7/27/2004 Jul28, 2004 Aug 2, 2004

gQ Jyg j ggiggg g AFE Amount Auth.TD. Comoa iv Reoresentative

520 520 $827,000 8,500 Norman Woods

Present Oonration Rig Phone: Toolousher

MIRU Union Rig #7 Rig Fax:

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No LCSO Samule Date Operator RKS 15 ft

seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date Water Depth 11

Sky: No Pass? O Yes O No Service RKB-CHF fi

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wl. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conducdor 12 3/4" 24 LP Wefd 2 35 35 Air

Suttace B 5/8" 24 KSS STC 13 513 513 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICS REt ORD
BIT Bit Type and Tota Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Foota e Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Beatinq Gage

Bit Remarks Cum ROT. Hrs PU WI SO Wt ROTWI To ue
19 25

Pump
Slow Pu Pressures

No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Pu

DC DP 1/4

1 9x6 315 1/2

2 14x55 437 3/4

BHA
Length Description:

P

Smpi F L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Com an

Pf #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desill Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIREC110NAL SURVEYS
MD TVD VS CLOSURE

OPERAliONS SU AMARY
TI AL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name Status:

0600 1800 12 0 1 Movingrig to location. Mud tanks on location. Time Si mmary
Rig movingon location 8/2 and8/3. Activg Daig Cum.

1. Mob/DeMob 12 21.5
2. Cement 2.5

Neilson Construction on location 0800 - 1200 hrs, spread4 loads of 2" 3. Circulate 2

rock on location. Est. 144 ton 4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 19.25

Unable to get48" cellarring WII deliver Monday moming 6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ
10 DrillCmt.ILOT
11 N U./ N D.
12 P U.lL.D.BHA 3.5
13 P U./L.D.Pipe
14 RIU;RID 1.5
15 Rig Repair 6 25
16 Run Casing 6 5
17 Service Rig 0 5
18 Sidetrack Op
19 Stuck Pipe
20 Survey

24 W W

27 W3C 12 5

Total dours 12 0
Rig Drentime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $94,896

Daily Daily Gals Cement sx Daily Cost $1,600
Cum. 6.3 his Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum.Cost

PPI MSC Exploration
no ' Daily Drilling Report

Block. Lease and WellNo. Contract Rio g ggg Date on Location Soud Date Renoit Date

E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 6 5 7/27/2004 Jul28, 2004 Aug 2, 2004

gQ Jyg j ggiggg g AFE Amount Auth.TD. Comoa iv Reoresentative

520 520 $827,000 8,500 Norman Woods

Present Oonration Rig Phone: Toolousher

MIRU Union Rig #7 Rig Fax:

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No LCSO Samule Date Operator RKS 15 ft

seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date Water Depth 11

Sky: No Pass? O Yes O No Service RKB-CHF fi

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wl. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conducdor 12 3/4" 24 LP Wefd 2 35 35 Air

Suttace B 5/8" 24 KSS STC 13 513 513 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICS REt ORD
BIT Bit Type and Tota Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Foota e Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Beatinq Gage

Bit Remarks Cum ROT. Hrs PU WI SO Wt ROTWI To ue
19 25

Pump
Slow Pu Pressures

No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Pu

DC DP 1/4

1 9x6 315 1/2

2 14x55 437 3/4

BHA
Length Description:

P

Smpi F L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Com an

Pf #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desill Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIREC110NAL SURVEYS
MD TVD VS CLOSURE

OPERAliONS SU AMARY
TI AL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name Status:

0600 1800 12 0 1 Movingrig to location. Mud tanks on location. Time Si mmary
Rig movingon location 8/2 and8/3. Activg Daig Cum.

1. Mob/DeMob 12 21.5
2. Cement 2.5

Neilson Construction on location 0800 - 1200 hrs, spread4 loads of 2" 3. Circulate 2

rock on location. Est. 144 ton 4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 19.25

Unable to get48" cellarring WII deliver Monday moming 6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ
10 DrillCmt.ILOT
11 N U./ N D.
12 P U.lL.D.BHA 3.5
13 P U./L.D.Pipe
14 RIU;RID 1.5
15 Rig Repair 6 25
16 Run Casing 6 5
17 Service Rig 0 5
18 Sidetrack Op
19 Stuck Pipe
20 Survey

24 W W

27 W3C 12 5

Total dours 12 0
Rig Drentime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $94,896

Daily Daily Gals Cement sx Daily Cost $1,600
Cum. 6.3 his Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum.Cost



MPPI MSC Exploration
neelSo ' Daily Drilling Report

BInck Lease and WellNo Contract Ria 9QL RES Date on Location Soud Date Report Date
E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 7 6 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 3, 2004

Mg TV(_D Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative
520 520 $827,000 8,500' Norman Woods

Present Operption Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpysher
MIRU Union Rig #7 Rig Fax: Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: e No LCSO Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem7 O Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass7 O Yes No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Sudace 8 5/8" 24 KSS STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICSREf ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remprks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
19.26

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV eed SPM

pps DC DP 1/4

LHe
gth Description:

smpl F.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

#1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud Cl Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
TVD CLOSURE

OPERATIONS SUDIMARY
¡AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0800 2.0 28 Spreading graveland watering down location. Time SL mmary
0800 1130 3.5 28 Installed 48" cellar ring around wellhead. Bladed gravel where rig will set. Activity Daily Cum.
1130 1800 6.5 1 Waiting on rig to arrive. Derrick arrived at 1730 hrs 1. MoblDeMob 6.5 28

2. Cement 2.5
3. Circulate 2
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 19.25

On location: Dailey jars, 4 - stabilizers, 2 - mud pumps, mud cleaner 6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing

Trailers coming in today: 8. OH Logging
From Mountain West Rentals: 9. Lost Circ.

Company Man'strailerloffice 10. DrillCmt./LOT
MudEngineer's Shack 11. N.U./ N.D.

From Great Divide: 12. P.U.lL.D.BHA 3.5
Mud Loggin Unitw/ quarters 13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe

From Mr. Ballsley: 14. R/U; R/D 1.5
Trailer for Jim Jones &Jack Stanley 15. Rig Repair 6.25

From Larry Moyer: 16. Run Casing 6.5
Personal Travel Trailer 17. Service Rig 0.5

18. Sidetrack Op.
Total 5 trailerson location. 19. Stuck Pipe

20. Survey
21. Trips 3
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO

26. Well ControlDECI J im 27 woe _12.s

28. Other 5.5 36.75

Total dours 12.0
01"DFOIL,CACã Mimig

'°tal 12 122.25

Rig Dcantime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $96,496
Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $6,088
Cum. 6.3 hrs Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

MPPI MSC Exploration
neelSo ' Daily Drilling Report

BInck Lease and WellNo Contract Ria 9QL RES Date on Location Soud Date Report Date
E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 7 6 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 3, 2004

Mg TV(_D Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative
520 520 $827,000 8,500' Norman Woods

Present Operption Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpysher
MIRU Union Rig #7 Rig Fax: Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: e No LCSO Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem7 O Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass7 O Yes No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Sudace 8 5/8" 24 KSS STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICSREf ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remprks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
19.26

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV eed SPM

pps DC DP 1/4

LHe
gth Description:

smpl F.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

#1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud Cl Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
TVD CLOSURE

OPERATIONS SUDIMARY
¡AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0800 2.0 28 Spreading graveland watering down location. Time SL mmary
0800 1130 3.5 28 Installed 48" cellar ring around wellhead. Bladed gravel where rig will set. Activity Daily Cum.
1130 1800 6.5 1 Waiting on rig to arrive. Derrick arrived at 1730 hrs 1. MoblDeMob 6.5 28

2. Cement 2.5
3. Circulate 2
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 19.25

On location: Dailey jars, 4 - stabilizers, 2 - mud pumps, mud cleaner 6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing

Trailers coming in today: 8. OH Logging
From Mountain West Rentals: 9. Lost Circ.

Company Man'strailerloffice 10. DrillCmt./LOT
MudEngineer's Shack 11. N.U./ N.D.

From Great Divide: 12. P.U.lL.D.BHA 3.5
Mud Loggin Unitw/ quarters 13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe

From Mr. Ballsley: 14. R/U; R/D 1.5
Trailer for Jim Jones &Jack Stanley 15. Rig Repair 6.25

From Larry Moyer: 16. Run Casing 6.5
Personal Travel Trailer 17. Service Rig 0.5

18. Sidetrack Op.
Total 5 trailerson location. 19. Stuck Pipe

20. Survey
21. Trips 3
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO

26. Well ControlDECI J im 27 woe _12.s

28. Other 5.5 36.75

Total dours 12.0
01"DFOIL,CACã Mimig

'°tal 12 122.25

Rig Dcantime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $96,496
Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $6,088
Cum. 6.3 hrs Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PI MSC Exploration- A"" Daily Drilling Report
Block I.enan and Well No. Contract RIa Date on Location Soud Date ReDort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Unlon#7 9 8 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 5, 2004

TV) Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth.TO. Compa ty Representative

520 520 $827,000 8,500' Carl Huislander

Present ODeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

RU Union#7 Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR VIsit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: |__|Yes O No LC50Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass7 |_| Yes _j No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

blT, WEIGHT,SPEED ANDHibkAULICS RECORD

BIT BIt Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

BitRemarkg: Cum. ROT. Hra PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

BHA
Length: Description:

háUD bAVA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OlL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT

Smpi E.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

#1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD VS

OPERA1 ONS SUL1MARY
ThAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 1800 12.0 1 Trucking in remainder of drilling rig. All rig compents on location. Time St mmary

Set mud cleaner and centrifuge in place. Activity Daily Cum.

1. Mob/DeMob 12 51

Mud products arrived on location 2. Cement 2.5

Started water haul 3. Circulate 2

Intemet installed in 3 trailers 4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 19.25

Correction to trailerson location: 6. Drive Pipe

From Mountain West Rentals: 7. Fishing

Company Man's trailerloffice 8. OH Logging

Mud Engineefs Shack 9. Lost Circ.

From Great Divide: 10. DrillCmt./LOT

Mud Logging Unit w/ quarters 11. N.U./ N.D.
From Mr. Ballsley: 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 3.5

Trailer for Jim Jones, Larry Moyer & Jack Stanley 13. P.U./L.D. Pipe

From UnionRig#7: 14. R/U; R/D 1.5

Toolpusher's trailer 15. Rig Repair 6.25
16. Run Casing 6.5
17. Service Rig 0.5
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips 3
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.

RECEIVED 2
.ihC nReani

27. WOC 12.5

DEC13 ¿m 28. Other 36.75
Total 12 145.25

Total dours 12.0 on
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulk Materialon Board - - - L,CA3ã ivill gus Cost $106,630

Daily Daily Gals ement: sx Daily Cost $7,898
Cum. 6.3 hrs Cum. Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost

PI MSC Exploration- A"" Daily Drilling Report
Block I.enan and Well No. Contract RIa Date on Location Soud Date ReDort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Unlon#7 9 8 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 5, 2004

TV) Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth.TO. Compa ty Representative

520 520 $827,000 8,500' Carl Huislander

Present ODeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

RU Union#7 Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR VIsit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: |__|Yes O No LC50Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass7 |_| Yes _j No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

blT, WEIGHT,SPEED ANDHibkAULICS RECORD

BIT BIt Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

BitRemarkg: Cum. ROT. Hra PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

BHA
Length: Description:

háUD bAVA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OlL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT

Smpi E.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

#1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD VS

OPERA1 ONS SUL1MARY
ThAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 1800 12.0 1 Trucking in remainder of drilling rig. All rig compents on location. Time St mmary

Set mud cleaner and centrifuge in place. Activity Daily Cum.

1. Mob/DeMob 12 51

Mud products arrived on location 2. Cement 2.5

Started water haul 3. Circulate 2

Intemet installed in 3 trailers 4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 19.25

Correction to trailerson location: 6. Drive Pipe

From Mountain West Rentals: 7. Fishing

Company Man's trailerloffice 8. OH Logging

Mud Engineefs Shack 9. Lost Circ.

From Great Divide: 10. DrillCmt./LOT

Mud Logging Unit w/ quarters 11. N.U./ N.D.
From Mr. Ballsley: 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 3.5

Trailer for Jim Jones, Larry Moyer & Jack Stanley 13. P.U./L.D. Pipe

From UnionRig#7: 14. R/U; R/D 1.5

Toolpusher's trailer 15. Rig Repair 6.25
16. Run Casing 6.5
17. Service Rig 0.5

18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips 3

22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.

RECEIVED 2
.ihC nReani

27. WOC 12.5

DEC13 ¿m 28. Other 36.75
Total 12 145.25

Total dours 12.0 on
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulk Materialon Board - - - L,CA3ã ivill gus Cost $106,630

Daily Daily Gals ement: sx Daily Cost $7,898
Cum. 6.3 hrs Cum. Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Explorationne Daily Drilling Report
Block Leaseand WêllNo. Contract Ria Qig Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

E Crested Juction WÙdcat- State MSC #35-1 Union #7 8 7 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 4, 2004
MD Q Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Comppny Representative

520 520 $827,000 8,500' Norman Woods
Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Tqqlpusher

WO Trucks to Move Union Rig #7 Rig Fax: Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BÒP Test Date RIGELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date Water Depth it
Sky: U No Pass7 O Yes U No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICS RE(ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets De th In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
19.26

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pump #3

gps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2
2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

eHnAgth:
Description:

Smpi EL
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer MudCompany

PII #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD ANGLE

OPERATIONS SUE1MARY
E4E Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0630 0.5 1 WO rig crew Time St mmary
0630 1230 6.0 1 Substructure on location, installed derrick on rig, set substructure over hole, Activity Daily Cum.

set rig substructure 1. Mob/DeMob 11 39
1230 1700 4.5 1 Waiting on rest of rig to arrive. Truck broke down. 2. Cement 2.5

3. Circulate 2
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 19.25

Estimated 4 of total 13 loads of rig on location. DP has to be inspected 6. DrivePipe
before drilling. 7. Fishing

Septic tanks on location @1830 hrs. 8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./LD. BHA 3.5
13. P.U.lL.D. Pige
14. R/U; R/D 1.5
15. Rig Repair 6.25
16. Run Casing 6.5
17. Service Rig 0.5
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips 3
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 36.75

Total 11 133.25Total iours 11.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage BulkMaterial on Board Previous Cost $102,584Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $4,046Cum. 6.3 hrs Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

PPI MSC Explorationne Daily Drilling Report
Block Leaseand WêllNo. Contract Ria Qig Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

E Crested Juction WÙdcat- State MSC #35-1 Union #7 8 7 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 4, 2004
MD Q Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Comppny Representative

520 520 $827,000 8,500' Norman Woods
Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Tqqlpusher

WO Trucks to Move Union Rig #7 Rig Fax: Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BÒP Test Date RIGELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date Water Depth it
Sky: U No Pass7 O Yes U No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICS RE(ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets De th In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
19.26

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pump #3

gps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2
2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

eHnAgth:
Description:

Smpi EL
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer MudCompany

PII #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD ANGLE

OPERATIONS SUE1MARY
E4E Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0630 0.5 1 WO rig crew Time St mmary
0630 1230 6.0 1 Substructure on location, installed derrick on rig, set substructure over hole, Activity Daily Cum.

set rig substructure 1. Mob/DeMob 11 39
1230 1700 4.5 1 Waiting on rest of rig to arrive. Truck broke down. 2. Cement 2.5

3. Circulate 2
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 19.25

Estimated 4 of total 13 loads of rig on location. DP has to be inspected 6. DrivePipe
before drilling. 7. Fishing

Septic tanks on location @1830 hrs. 8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./LD. BHA 3.5
13. P.U.lL.D. Pige
14. R/U; R/D 1.5
15. Rig Repair 6.25
16. Run Casing 6.5
17. Service Rig 0.5
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips 3
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 36.75

Total 11 133.25Total iours 11.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage BulkMaterial on Board Previous Cost $102,584Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $4,046Cum. 6.3 hrs Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPÎ MSC ExplorationMi ne*Ã° Daily Dritiing Report
Block.Lease and WellNo. ColitractRio 9.9.6 REB. Date on Location Soud Date Reanrt Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 11 10 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 7, 2004
yll.Q g Fogtage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth.TD. Company Representative

602 602 74 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

CurrentWeather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: Yes [_) No ÇÇ50Sample Dpte Operator 1 8/6/04 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 U Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: No Pass7 U Yes O No Service 2 9/6/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Settin Depth Uner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED ANDH/DRAULICSREf ORD

BIT BitType and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

3 7 7/8" MX11 Hughes 5023539 11, 12, 12 528' 74' 4 5-15 70-80 18.5

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

& - - --.....

DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

BHA
Length: 587' Description: bit, 1- bit sub (3.22'), 2- 6 1/4" DC (61.70'), 1 IBS (4.05'), 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.84'), 1- IBS (4.45'), 9 - DC 6 1/4" (275.35')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT 8.4 38 12 6 5/12 10.0 0/0 0.5 nii 9 0.25 0.8

Smpi i-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

00 80 8) 82 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
145 145 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Deslit Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 9,562 $3,189

528 528 2.75 °

OPERATONS SUitMARY
JIE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0700 1.0 14 Installed flow line Time St mmary

0700 1200 5.0 22 Tested rams, choke and killlines, upper kelly, safety valves, choke Activity Daily Cum.

manifold to 3000 psi for 10 mins. Low to 250 psi 5 min. Tested good 1. Mob/DeMob 75

Annular tested 1500 psi for 10 mins. Low 250 ps! for 5 mins. Casing 2. Cement 2.5

tested at 1500 psi for 30 mins,Everything tested good 3. Circulate 2

1200 1400 2.0 12 Installed wear ring, drive bushing, strapped BHA 4. Directional Work

1400 1500 1.0 12 Unload 4 - 6 1/4" DC's 5. Drilling 4 23.25

1500 1700 2.0 12 PU BHA 6. Drive Pipe

Swarm of flying ants accumulated on rig floor. Drove rig hands off floor 7. Fishing
1700 1800 1.0 15 Repair air leaks 8. OH Logging

1800 2230 4.5 12 Continue to PU BHA. Tagged cement at 523.5' 9. Lost Circ.

2230 0130 3.0 10 Drill5 ' cement, baffle plate and shoe 10. Drill Cmt./LOT 3 3

0130 0230 1.0 5 Drillingformation. 528'- 570' 11. N.U./ N.D.
0230 0300 0.5 20 Survey& Service Rig - 528' 2.75 deg 12. P.U.lL.D.BHA 9.5 13

0300 0600 3.0 5 Drilling570' to 602' 13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. RIU; R/D 1 2.5
15. Rip Repair 1 7.25

16. Run Casing 6.5

17. Service Rig 0.5
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey 0.5 0.5
21. Trips 3
22. Tst. BOPs 5 5
23. UR/HO

HH:HVED 24.W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream

28. Other 36.75

Total dours 24.0
GL GARA NNG Total 24 193.25

Rig DONntime Fuel Usage ulk Material on Board Prevlous Cost $119,756

Daily Daily Gals ement: sx DailyCost $35,073

Cum. 6.3 hrs Cum. Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost

PPÎ MSC ExplorationMi ne*Ã° Daily Dritiing Report
Block.Lease and WellNo. ColitractRio 9.9.6 REB. Date on Location Soud Date Reanrt Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 11 10 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 7, 2004

yll.Q g Fogtage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth.TD. Company Representative

602 602 74 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

CurrentWeather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: Yes [_) No ÇÇ50Sample Dpte Operator 1 8/6/04 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 U Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: No Pass7 U Yes O No Service 2 9/6/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Settin Depth Uner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED ANDH/DRAULICSREf ORD

BIT BitType and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

3 7 7/8" MX11 Hughes 5023539 11, 12, 12 528' 74' 4 5-15 70-80 18.5

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

& - - --.....

DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

BHA
Length: 587' Description: bit, 1- bit sub (3.22'), 2- 6 1/4" DC (61.70'), 1 IBS (4.05'), 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.84'), 1- IBS (4.45'), 9 - DC 6 1/4" (275.35')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT 8.4 38 12 6 5/12 10.0 0/0 0.5 nii 9 0.25 0.8

Smpi i-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

00 80 8) 82 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
145 145 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Deslit Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 9,562 $3,189

528 528 2.75 °

OPERATONS SUitMARY
JIE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0700 1.0 14 Installed flow line Time St mmary

0700 1200 5.0 22 Tested rams, choke and killlines, upper kelly, safety valves, choke Activity Daily Cum.

manifold to 3000 psi for 10 mins. Low to 250 psi 5 min. Tested good 1. Mob/DeMob 75

Annular tested 1500 psi for 10 mins. Low 250 ps! for 5 mins. Casing 2. Cement 2.5

tested at 1500 psi for 30 mins,Everything tested good 3. Circulate 2

1200 1400 2.0 12 Installed wear ring, drive bushing, strapped BHA 4. Directional Work

1400 1500 1.0 12 Unload 4 - 6 1/4" DC's 5. Drilling 4 23.25

1500 1700 2.0 12 PU BHA 6. Drive Pipe

Swarm of flying ants accumulated on rig floor. Drove rig hands off floor 7. Fishing
1700 1800 1.0 15 Repair air leaks 8. OH Logging

1800 2230 4.5 12 Continue to PU BHA. Tagged cement at 523.5' 9. Lost Circ.

2230 0130 3.0 10 Drill5 ' cement, baffle plate and shoe 10. Drill Cmt./LOT 3 3

0130 0230 1.0 5 Drillingformation. 528'- 570' 11. N.U./ N.D.
0230 0300 0.5 20 Survey& Service Rig - 528' 2.75 deg 12. P.U.lL.D.BHA 9.5 13

0300 0600 3.0 5 Drilling570' to 602' 13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. RIU; R/D 1 2.5
15. Rip Repair 1 7.25

16. Run Casing 6.5

17. Service Rig 0.5

18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey 0.5 0.5

21. Trips 3
22. Tst. BOPs 5 5
23. UR/HO

HH:HVED 24.W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream

28. Other 36.75

Total dours 24.0
GL GARA NNG Total 24 193.25

Rig DONntime Fuel Usage ulk Material on Board Prevlous Cost $119,756

Daily Daily Gals ement: sx DailyCost $35,073

Cum. 6.3 hrs Cum. Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration$$¡nc* Daily Drilling Report
Block, Lease pod Well Ne, Contract Ria R.OL D.Eg Date on Leêptien Soud Date Report Date

E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 10 9 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 6, 2004
MQ TV._D Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth.TD. Company Representative
520 520 $827,000 8,500' . Carl Hulslander

Present 9peration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 olpusher
RU flowline. Prep to install BOP's Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: ast BOPTest Date RIGELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes U No LCSO Sample Date Operator KB 15 it
Seas: Problem7 U Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date ater Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass7 O Yes O No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Settin< Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HiDRAULICS RELORD
BIT BitType and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV LS eed SPM

gps DC DP i 1/4
...-. . . . . .... . . ....... .. . . ,

1/2
2 14 x 5 5 4.37 3/4

L gth: Description:

Smpi E.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pil #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
$$0 $1,62)

MD ANGLE VS CLOSURE

OPERAT ONS SUf1MARY
ThAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1800 12.0 1 Continue to rig up. Toolsordered to drill mouse and rat hole. Brandt Time SL mmary

and Swaco continue to rig up equipment. Activity Daily Cum.
1800 1900 1.0 1 Unload tools to drill mouse and rat hole 1. Mob/DeMob 24 75
1900 2000 1.0 1 Work shut down due to severe rain wind and lightning, Flash flooding 2. Cement 2.5

washed through2' berm on west side of location and entered location. 3. Circulate 2
Berm rebuilt. Water traveledaround north side of location and berm on 4. Directional Work
south side held. Watered flowed by location for at least 2 hrs before 5. Drilling 19.25
slowing down and subsiding. 6. Drive Pige

2000 2200 2.0 1 RU pumps and cellarjet 7. Fishing
2200 0000 2.0 1 RU mouse and rat hole drilling tools 8. OHLogging
0000 0500 5.0 1 Drillmouse and rat holes 9. Lost Circ.
0500 0600 1.0 1 RU flow line 10. DrillCmt.lLOT

11. N.U./N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 3.5
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 1.5
15. Rig Repair 6.25
16. Run Casing 6.5
17. Service Rig 0.5
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips 3
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 36.75

Total iours 24.0
Total 24 169.25

Rig Do.vntime Fuel Usage BulkMaterial on Board Prevlous Cost $114,528
Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx DailyCost $5,228Cum. 6.3 hrs Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

PPI MSC Exploration$$¡nc* Daily Drilling Report
Block, Lease pod Well Ne, Contract Ria R.OL D.Eg Date on Leêptien Soud Date Report Date

E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 10 9 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 6, 2004
MQ TV._D Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth.TD. Company Representative
520 520 $827,000 8,500' . Carl Hulslander

Present 9peration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 olpusher
RU flowline. Prep to install BOP's Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: ast BOPTest Date RIGELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes U No LCSO Sample Date Operator KB 15 it
Seas: Problem7 U Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date ater Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass7 O Yes O No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Settin< Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HiDRAULICS RELORD
BIT BitType and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV LS eed SPM

gps DC DP i 1/4
...-. . . . . .... . . ....... .. . . ,

1/2
2 14 x 5 5 4.37 3/4

L gth: Description:

Smpi E.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pil #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
$$0 $1,62)

MD ANGLE VS CLOSURE

OPERAT ONS SUf1MARY
ThAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1800 12.0 1 Continue to rig up. Toolsordered to drill mouse and rat hole. Brandt Time SL mmary

and Swaco continue to rig up equipment. Activity Daily Cum.
1800 1900 1.0 1 Unload tools to drill mouse and rat hole 1. Mob/DeMob 24 75
1900 2000 1.0 1 Work shut down due to severe rain wind and lightning, Flash flooding 2. Cement 2.5

washed through2' berm on west side of location and entered location. 3. Circulate 2
Berm rebuilt. Water traveledaround north side of location and berm on 4. Directional Work
south side held. Watered flowed by location for at least 2 hrs before 5. Drilling 19.25
slowing down and subsiding. 6. Drive Pige

2000 2200 2.0 1 RU pumps and cellarjet 7. Fishing
2200 0000 2.0 1 RU mouse and rat hole drilling tools 8. OHLogging
0000 0500 5.0 1 Drillmouse and rat holes 9. Lost Circ.
0500 0600 1.0 1 RU flow line 10. DrillCmt.lLOT

11. N.U./N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 3.5
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 1.5
15. Rig Repair 6.25
16. Run Casing 6.5
17. Service Rig 0.5
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips 3
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 36.75

Total iours 24.0
Total 24 169.25

Rig Do.vntime Fuel Usage BulkMaterial on Board Prevlous Cost $114,528
Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx DailyCost $5,228Cum. 6.3 hrs Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
s ¡" Dailyþñ1(ing Report

Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria ROL REÂ Dateon Location Soud Date Recort Date
E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 13 12 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 9, 2004

MR IV.2 Footaae AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Comoanv Reoresentative

961 961 139 $827,000 8,600' Carl Hulslander

Present ODeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No LC50Samote Date Operator 8/6/2004 KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date ater Depth ft

Sky: _|
No Pass7 O Yes O No Service 9/6/2004 KB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Settint Depth LinerTop MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED ANDHIDAAULICS REGOND
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

3 7 7/8" MX11 Hughes 5023539 11, 12, 12 528' 345' 38 10/25 80/100 9.1 2 1 1

3 RR 7 7/8" MX11 Hughes 5023539 11, 12, 12 873' 88' 8 10/25 80/100 11.0

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV g SPM

pps DC DP 1/4 46 320

1 9 x 6 3.16 118 371 1450 266 201 1/2 89 870

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4 118 1450

BHA
Length: 587 Description: bit, 1- bit sub (3.22'), 2- 6 1/4" DC (61.70'), 1 IBS (4.05'), 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.84'), 1-1BS (4.45'), 9 - DC 6 1/4" (275.35')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6-61/4" DC (176.18')

M

smpi RL
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PlË i600 60 86 86 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
145 145 24 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Deslit MudCI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTI )NALSURVEYS
145 24 2,963 $11,63)

IVD TVD
801 801 2.75 *

Bai 861 3.50 *

OPERATONS SU,1MARY
¡AL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0930 3.5 5 Drillingto 843' Time St mmary

0930 1000 0.5 20 Survey @801' - 2.75 deg Activity Daily Cum.

1000 1030 0.5 17 Service rig 1. Mob/DeMob 75

1030 1800 7.5 5 Drillingto 873' 2. Cement 2.5

1800 1830 0.5 20 Survey (d)861' - 3.5 deg 3. Circulate 2

1830 2030 2.0 21 TOOH, Found a 1 1/2" x 3/8" x 3/4" piece of hardened metal dangling 4. Directional Work

between cones of bit. Minimal flattening to 4 buttons on two cones 5. Drilling 19 65.25

bit rerunable, changed out IBS to under gage size. 6. Drive Pipe

2030 2200 1.5 21 TlH 7. Fishing

2200 0600 8.0 5 Drillingto 961'. Weight8-10 K, 100 rpm, 20 ftl hr avg. At 0300, pushed 8. OH Logging

additional junkaside, drilling rate increased at that time 9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt.lLOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13

Formation Mancos Shale - 2% sand, 98 % shale 13. P.U./L.D. Pige

BG = 5 -25 units 14. R/U; R/D 2.5

CG = 0 units 15. Rig Repair 7.75

TG - 65 units 16. Run Casing 6.5

Form G = 0 17. Service Rig 0.5 1.5
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey 1 1.5

21. Trips 3.5 6.5
22. Tst. BOPs 5
23. UR/HORECEIVL-I) 24.W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream

ORC 1 26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 36.75

Lbe &WNWO Total 24 241.25

Total dours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious Cost $180,413

Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx ailyCost $21,816
Cum. 6.3 hrs Cum. Gals Barite: sx um. Cost

PPI MSC Exploration
s ¡" Dailyþñ1(ing Report

Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria ROL REÂ Dateon Location Soud Date Recort Date
E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 13 12 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 9, 2004

MR IV.2 Footaae AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Comoanv Reoresentative

961 961 139 $827,000 8,600' Carl Hulslander

Present ODeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No LC50Samote Date Operator 8/6/2004 KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date ater Depth ft

Sky: _|
No Pass7 O Yes O No Service 9/6/2004 KB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Settint Depth LinerTop MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED ANDHIDAAULICS REGOND
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

3 7 7/8" MX11 Hughes 5023539 11, 12, 12 528' 345' 38 10/25 80/100 9.1 2 1 1

3 RR 7 7/8" MX11 Hughes 5023539 11, 12, 12 873' 88' 8 10/25 80/100 11.0

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV g SPM

pps DC DP 1/4 46 320

1 9 x 6 3.16 118 371 1450 266 201 1/2 89 870

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4 118 1450

BHA
Length: 587 Description: bit, 1- bit sub (3.22'), 2- 6 1/4" DC (61.70'), 1 IBS (4.05'), 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.84'), 1-1BS (4.45'), 9 - DC 6 1/4" (275.35')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6-61/4" DC (176.18')

M

smpi RL
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PlË i600 60 86 86 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
145 145 24 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Deslit MudCI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTI )NALSURVEYS
145 24 2,963 $11,63)

IVD TVD
801 801 2.75 *

Bai 861 3.50 *

OPERATONS SU,1MARY
¡AL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0930 3.5 5 Drillingto 843' Time St mmary

0930 1000 0.5 20 Survey @801' - 2.75 deg Activity Daily Cum.

1000 1030 0.5 17 Service rig 1. Mob/DeMob 75

1030 1800 7.5 5 Drillingto 873' 2. Cement 2.5

1800 1830 0.5 20 Survey (d)861' - 3.5 deg 3. Circulate 2

1830 2030 2.0 21 TOOH, Found a 1 1/2" x 3/8" x 3/4" piece of hardened metal dangling 4. Directional Work

between cones of bit. Minimal flattening to 4 buttons on two cones 5. Drilling 19 65.25

bit rerunable, changed out IBS to under gage size. 6. Drive Pipe

2030 2200 1.5 21 TlH 7. Fishing

2200 0600 8.0 5 Drillingto 961'. Weight8-10 K, 100 rpm, 20 ftl hr avg. At 0300, pushed 8. OH Logging

additional junkaside, drilling rate increased at that time 9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt.lLOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13

Formation Mancos Shale - 2% sand, 98 % shale 13. P.U./L.D. Pige

BG = 5 -25 units 14. R/U; R/D 2.5

CG = 0 units 15. Rig Repair 7.75

TG - 65 units 16. Run Casing 6.5

Form G = 0 17. Service Rig 0.5 1.5

18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey 1 1.5

21. Trips 3.5 6.5

22. Tst. BOPs 5

23. UR/HORECEIVL-I) 24.W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream

ORC 1 26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 36.75

Lbe &WNWO Total 24 241.25

Total dours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious Cost $180,413

Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx ailyCost $21,816

Cum. 6.3 hrs Cum. Gals Barite: sx um. Cost



PI MSC Explorationse$vine* Daily Drilling Report
Block Legse and Well No. Contract Ria g QFR Dgtpon Location Soud Date Reoort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 12 11 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 8, 2004
MD g Footaqe AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Compa ty Representative

822 822 222 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander
Present Oueration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

|Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LCSO Sample Date Operator 1 8/6/04 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem7 U Yes Contractor 11 Next BOPTest Date Water Depth ft
Sky: Ù No Pass? O Yes No Service 2 9/6/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED ANDHIDRAULIÔSRE( ORD
BIT BitType and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
3 7 7/8" MX11 Hughes 5023539 11, 12, 12 528' 286' 26 4-23 80 11.0

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROl Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM #3

gps DC DP 1/4 47 290
1 9 x 6 3.15 118 372 1400 1/2 61 390
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 587' Description: bit, 1- bit sub (3.22'), 2- 6 1/4" DC (61.70'), 1 IBS(4.05'), 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.84'), 1- IBS (4.45'), 9 - DC 6 1/4" (275.35')

1- 6 1/4 jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')

smpi l-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PII 9600 160 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
145 145 24 John Limon M-I
#3 #4 Desilt MudCI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 18 $5,395 58,584

MD
710 710 2.25 *

1PERATI TNS SUN MARY
¡AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1930 13.5 5 Drillingw/ LSND mud to 752' w/ 10 k &80 rpm Time St mmary
1930 2000 0.5 17 Service rig and survey Activity Daily Cum.
2000 2030 0.5 15 Replace U jointon drive line 1. MoblDeMob 75
2030 0600 9.5 5 Drilllingto 822', 20 -25K bit weight 2. Cement 2.5

3. Circulate 2
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 23 46.25

Mancos Shale, 5% sd, 95% shale and siltstone 6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing

No shows: 8. OH Logging
BG - 5 -21 units 9. Lost Circ.
CG - 0 units 10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
FG - O units 11. N.U.I N.D.

12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. RIU; R/D 2.5
15. Rig Repair 0.5 7.75
16. Run Casing 6.5
17. Service Rig 0.5 1
18. SidetrackOp.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey 0.5
21. Trips 3
22. Tst. BOPs 5
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 36.75

Total 24 217.25Total lours 24.0
Rig DONntime Fuel Usage ulk Materialon Board revious Cost $154,829Daily Daily Gals ement: sx allyCost $25,584Cum. 6.3 hrs Cum. Gals arite: sx um. Cost

PI MSC Explorationse$vine* Daily Drilling Report
Block Legse and Well No. Contract Ria g QFR Dgtpon Location Soud Date Reoort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 12 11 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 8, 2004
MD g Footaqe AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Compa ty Representative

822 822 222 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander
Present Oueration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

|Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LCSO Sample Date Operator 1 8/6/04 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem7 U Yes Contractor 11 Next BOPTest Date Water Depth ft
Sky: Ù No Pass? O Yes No Service 2 9/6/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED ANDHIDRAULIÔSRE( ORD
BIT BitType and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
3 7 7/8" MX11 Hughes 5023539 11, 12, 12 528' 286' 26 4-23 80 11.0

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROl Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM #3

gps DC DP 1/4 47 290
1 9 x 6 3.15 118 372 1400 1/2 61 390
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 587' Description: bit, 1- bit sub (3.22'), 2- 6 1/4" DC (61.70'), 1 IBS(4.05'), 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.84'), 1- IBS (4.45'), 9 - DC 6 1/4" (275.35')

1- 6 1/4 jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')

smpi l-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PII 9600 160 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
145 145 24 John Limon M-I
#3 #4 Desilt MudCI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 18 $5,395 58,584

MD
710 710 2.25 *

1PERATI TNS SUN MARY
¡AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1930 13.5 5 Drillingw/ LSND mud to 752' w/ 10 k &80 rpm Time St mmary
1930 2000 0.5 17 Service rig and survey Activity Daily Cum.
2000 2030 0.5 15 Replace U jointon drive line 1. MoblDeMob 75
2030 0600 9.5 5 Drilllingto 822', 20 -25K bit weight 2. Cement 2.5

3. Circulate 2
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 23 46.25

Mancos Shale, 5% sd, 95% shale and siltstone 6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing

No shows: 8. OH Logging
BG - 5 -21 units 9. Lost Circ.
CG - 0 units 10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
FG - O units 11. N.U.I N.D.

12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. RIU; R/D 2.5
15. Rig Repair 0.5 7.75
16. Run Casing 6.5
17. Service Rig 0.5 1
18. SidetrackOp.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey 0.5
21. Trips 3
22. Tst. BOPs 5
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 36.75

Total 24 217.25Total lours 24.0
Rig DONntime Fuel Usage ulk Materialon Board revious Cost $154,829Daily Daily Gals ement: sx allyCost $25,584Cum. 6.3 hrs Cum. Gals arite: sx um. Cost



MPPI MSC Exploration
"c"A"' Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease and Well No. Contract RIa 996 QEg Date on Location Soud Date ReDort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 15 14 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 11, 2004

Mg TVJ Footage AFE Ne. AFEAmount Aûth.TD. Compa iy Representative

2,864 2,864 1,167 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present ODeratlon Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Tonipusher

Circulateair and adding foamer to unload hole Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 16 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: U Yes U No LCSOSample Detp Operator 1 8/6/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 U Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: O No Pass? O Yes No Service 4 9/6/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 KSS STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT,SPEED AND HibnAutics asc..ono
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

4 RR 7 7/8" Marquis C683G mb78112 open 1,147 1,71T 28 1/2 2/3 40 60.2

BitRemarke: Used bit from State MSC#16-1 Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
501.25 94 82 88

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 Pump #3

qqs DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 582' Description: Air hammer bit(4,58') - bit sub (3.22'), 12- 6 1/4" DC (367.89'), jars (30.23'), 6 - DC 6 1/4" (176.18')

ÑUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OlL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pi/Mf

PIT DRILLING WITH AIR AT 2400 CFM & 200 PS

I I l l
Smpi |-.L.

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

#1 #2 Desand Cent.
145 145 N John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Deslit Mud CI DailyCost Cumulative Cost

146 N $14,072
DIRECTIONALSU IVEYS

MD TVD ANGLE Dlrection Coordinates VS DL CLOSURE

1655 3.25•

2159/2609 3.00 *

OPERATIONS SUbiMARY
Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 1300 7.0 5 Air drilling to 209T Time SL mmary

1300 1600 3.0 28 Weld water spray assembly to blooie line Activity Daily Cum.

1600 1730 1.5 5 Air drilling to 2189' i. Mob/DeMob 75

1730 1800 0.5 20 Survey g 2159' - 3 deg 2. Cement 2.5

1800 0030 6.5 5 Air drilling to 2651' 3. Circulate 2 5
0030¯

0100 0.5 20 Survey g 2609' - 3 deg 4. Directional Work

0100 0400 3.0 5 Air drilling to 2864'. Encountered water. 5. Drilling 18 101.25

0400 0600 2.0 3 Circulateand adding foamer to clean hole. Waiting for returns. 6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U.! N.D.
12. P.U.lL.D. BHA 13
13. P.UJL.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5
15. Rig Repair 7.75
16. Run Casing 6.5

17. Service Rig 2

Formation Mancos Shale - surface to Dakota sd 18. Sidetrack Op.

Dakota Sand stone. - 2230' 19. Stuck Pipe

Morrison - 2460' 20. Survey 1 3.5
21. Trips 10

BG = 5 -25 units 22. Tst. BOPs 5

CG=0units RECEIVED " "'"°

TG - 0 units 24. W.O.W.

Form G = 0 25. Wash &ReamDEC13 ¿wt 26, Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 3 39.75

Total 24 289.25

Total dours 24.0

Ri¶ Downtime Fuel Usage ulk Materialon Board Prevlous Cost $226,366

Daily Daily 882 Gals ement: sx Daily Cost $28,761
Cum. 7.8 hrs Cum. 5920 Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost

MPPI MSC Exploration
"c"A"' Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease and Well No. Contract RIa 996 QEg Date on Location Soud Date ReDort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 15 14 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 11, 2004

Mg TVJ Footage AFE Ne. AFEAmount Aûth.TD. Compa iy Representative

2,864 2,864 1,167 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present ODeratlon Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Tonipusher

Circulateair and adding foamer to unload hole Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 16 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: U Yes U No LCSOSample Detp Operator 1 8/6/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 U Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: O No Pass? O Yes No Service 4 9/6/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 KSS STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT,SPEED AND HibnAutics asc..ono
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

4 RR 7 7/8" Marquis C683G mb78112 open 1,147 1,71T 28 1/2 2/3 40 60.2

BitRemarke: Used bit from State MSC#16-1 Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
501.25 94 82 88

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 Pump #3

qqs DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 582' Description: Air hammer bit(4,58') - bit sub (3.22'), 12- 6 1/4" DC (367.89'), jars (30.23'), 6 - DC 6 1/4" (176.18')

ÑUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OlL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pi/Mf

PIT DRILLING WITH AIR AT 2400 CFM & 200 PS

I I l l
Smpi |-.L.

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

#1 #2 Desand Cent.
145 145 N John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Deslit Mud CI DailyCost Cumulative Cost

146 N $14,072
DIRECTIONALSU IVEYS

MD TVD ANGLE Dlrection Coordinates VS DL CLOSURE

1655 3.25•

2159/2609 3.00 *

OPERATIONS SUbiMARY
Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 1300 7.0 5 Air drilling to 209T Time SL mmary

1300 1600 3.0 28 Weld water spray assembly to blooie line Activity Daily Cum.

1600 1730 1.5 5 Air drilling to 2189' i. Mob/DeMob 75

1730 1800 0.5 20 Survey g 2159' - 3 deg 2. Cement 2.5

1800 0030 6.5 5 Air drilling to 2651' 3. Circulate 2 5
0030¯

0100 0.5 20 Survey g 2609' - 3 deg 4. Directional Work

0100 0400 3.0 5 Air drilling to 2864'. Encountered water. 5. Drilling 18 101.25

0400 0600 2.0 3 Circulateand adding foamer to clean hole. Waiting for returns. 6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U.! N.D.
12. P.U.lL.D. BHA 13

13. P.UJL.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5
15. Rig Repair 7.75

16. Run Casing 6.5

17. Service Rig 2

Formation Mancos Shale - surface to Dakota sd 18. Sidetrack Op.

Dakota Sand stone. - 2230' 19. Stuck Pipe

Morrison - 2460' 20. Survey 1 3.5

21. Trips 10

BG = 5 -25 units 22. Tst. BOPs 5

CG=0units RECEIVED " "'"°

TG - 0 units 24. W.O.W.

Form G = 0 25. Wash &Ream
DEC13 ¿wt 26, Well Control

27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 3 39.75

Total 24 289.25

Total dours 24.0

Ri¶ Downtime Fuel Usage ulk Materialon Board Prevlous Cost $226,366

Daily Daily 882 Gals ement: sx Daily Cost $28,761
Cum. 7.8 hrs Cum. 5920 Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
"c°|* Daily Drilling Report

Block Leaseand WellNo. Contract Ria QQL ûE§ Date on Location Soud Date Reanrt Date

E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 14 13 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 10, 2004
MIJ TV__.2 Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. ÇompanyRepresentative

1,697 1,697 736 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander
Present Qperatiqn Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher

Prep to take Survey Rig Fax: 435-2204)999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 16 ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: [_]Yes _j No LC50Sample Date Operator 1 6/6/04 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? O Yes O No Service 4 9/6/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H IDRAULICS RE(ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No SIze Manufacturer Serial Number dets De th in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

3 RR 7 7/8" MX11 Hughes 5023539 11, 12, 12 873' 736' 15 1/2 10/25 80/100 47.5
4 RR 7 7/8" Marquis C683G mb78112 open 1,147' 550° 10 1/2 2-3 40 52.4

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROl Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM

gps 1/4 46 320
1 9 x 6 3.15 118 371 1450 266 201 1/2 89 870
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4 118 1450

LHe
gth: 582' Description:

Smpi |-.L.

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company
PÍ 8600 80 #1 #2 Desand Cent.

145 145 12 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 12 2,b $14,0i2

MD TVD
1075 1075 3.00 '

3PERATIONS SUL MARY
plE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1230 6.5 5 Drillingwl LSND mud to 1117'. RU AirComp Booster & rig compressors. Time SL mmary
1230 1300 0.5 20 Survey @ 1075' - 3 deg Activity Daily Cum.
1300 1330 0.5 17 Service rig 1. Mob/DeMob 75
1330 1430 1.0 5 Drilling to 1147' 2. Cement 2.5
1430 1600 1.5 21 TOOH, LD IBS. PU air hammer bit. Finish RU to air drill. ** 3. Circulate 1 3
1600 1800 2.0 21 TIH 4. Directional Work
1800 1900 1.0 3 Unload and dry hole 5. Drilling 18 83.25
1900 0330 8.5 5 Air drilling and dusting to 1605'. 6. Drive Pipe
0330 0400 0.5 20 Survey - miss run 7. Fishing
0400 0600 2.0 5 Air drilling to 169T 8. OH Logging

9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3

** Air hammer bit is the same bit used on State MSC #16-1. 11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5
15. Rig Repair 7.75
16. Run Casing 6.5
17. Service Rip 0.5 2
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey 1 2.5
21. Trips 3.5 10
22. Tst. BOPs 5
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 36.75

Total 24 265.25
Total dours 24 0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $202,229
Daily Daily 1260 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $24,137Cum. 7.8 hrs Cum. 1260 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

PPI MSC Exploration
"c°|* Daily Drilling Report

Block Leaseand WellNo. Contract Ria QQL ûE§ Date on Location Soud Date Reanrt Date

E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 14 13 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 10, 2004
MIJ TV__.2 Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. ÇompanyRepresentative

1,697 1,697 736 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander
Present Qperatiqn Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher

Prep to take Survey Rig Fax: 435-2204)999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 16 ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: [_]Yes _j No LC50Sample Date Operator 1 6/6/04 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? O Yes O No Service 4 9/6/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H IDRAULICS RE(ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No SIze Manufacturer Serial Number dets De th in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

3 RR 7 7/8" MX11 Hughes 5023539 11, 12, 12 873' 736' 15 1/2 10/25 80/100 47.5
4 RR 7 7/8" Marquis C683G mb78112 open 1,147' 550° 10 1/2 2-3 40 52.4

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROl Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM

gps 1/4 46 320
1 9 x 6 3.15 118 371 1450 266 201 1/2 89 870
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4 118 1450

LHe
gth: 582' Description:

Smpi |-.L.

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company
PÍ 8600 80 #1 #2 Desand Cent.

145 145 12 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 12 2,b $14,0i2

MD TVD
1075 1075 3.00 '

3PERATIONS SUL MARY
plE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1230 6.5 5 Drillingwl LSND mud to 1117'. RU AirComp Booster & rig compressors. Time SL mmary
1230 1300 0.5 20 Survey @ 1075' - 3 deg Activity Daily Cum.
1300 1330 0.5 17 Service rig 1. Mob/DeMob 75
1330 1430 1.0 5 Drilling to 1147' 2. Cement 2.5
1430 1600 1.5 21 TOOH, LD IBS. PU air hammer bit. Finish RU to air drill. ** 3. Circulate 1 3
1600 1800 2.0 21 TIH 4. Directional Work
1800 1900 1.0 3 Unload and dry hole 5. Drilling 18 83.25
1900 0330 8.5 5 Air drilling and dusting to 1605'. 6. Drive Pipe
0330 0400 0.5 20 Survey - miss run 7. Fishing
0400 0600 2.0 5 Air drilling to 169T 8. OH Logging

9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3

** Air hammer bit is the same bit used on State MSC #16-1. 11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5
15. Rig Repair 7.75
16. Run Casing 6.5
17. Service Rip 0.5 2
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey 1 2.5
21. Trips 3.5 10
22. Tst. BOPs 5
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 36.75

Total 24 265.25
Total dours 24 0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $202,229
Daily Daily 1260 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $24,137Cum. 7.8 hrs Cum. 1260 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



MPPI MSC Exploration
' Daily OrillingRåliört

Block. Lease and Well No. Contract Ria Ofg Date on I ocation Soud Date Report Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 17 16 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 13, 2004

MR TVD Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth.TD. Company Repreëentative

3,391 3,391 527 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operatiori Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People onLoc.: 15 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: LJ Y•s Ü No LC50 Sample Date Operator 1 8/6/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: ProbleA?O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: O No Pass7 L.]Yes U No Service 3 9/6/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 KSS STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED ANbHIDRAULICS RÊt.ORD

BIT BitType and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

5 77/8" HTCGTS18 5041747 12,13,13 2,864'52T 191/280 25/35 27.0

BitRempiks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

120.ib 9A 82 88

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4 48 180

1 9 x 6 3.15 120 378 1500 337 255 t/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA

ILength: 585' Description: bit, 1- bit sub (3.22'), 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.85'), 1 IBS (3.90'), 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.845), 1- IBS (3.07'), 10 - DC 6 1/4" (306.19')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT 8.8 41 14 16 2/15 7 2 0.3 0.25 9 9 0.2 .08/.33

Smpi I-.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

iI A0000 180 $9 89 #1 #2 Desand Cent.

K 2% 145 145 24 John Umon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECÝIONAL SU tVEYŠ
145 24 52,928 519,964

MD TVD ANGLE Direction Coordinates VS DL CLOSURE

3064 6064 3.50 *

OPERATIONSSU.1MARY
Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 1000 4.0 25 Wash and ream 2683' to 2864' Time St mmary

1000 1730 7.5 5 Drillingwith LSND mud 2864' - 3084' Activity Daily Cum.

1730 1800 0.5 20 Survey g 3064' - 3.5 deg 1. Mob/DeMob 75

1800 0600 12.0 5 Drillingwith LSND mud to 3391' 2. Cement 2.5
3. Circulate 8.5
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 19.5 120.75

6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging

Formation Mancos Shale - surface to Dakota sd 9. Lost Circ.

Dakota Sand stone. - 2230' 10. DrillCmt./LOT 3

Morrison - 2460' 11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13

13. P.U./L.D. Pipe

No gas readings available 14. R/U; R/D 2.5
15. Rig Repair 7.75
16. Run Casing 6.5
17. Service Rip 2
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey 0.5 4
21. Trips 15
22. Tst. BOPs 5
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.

RECEIVEI) 25.Wash&Ream 4 16
26. Well Control

Total 24 337.25

Total dours 24.0
RIq Downtime Fuel Usage BulkMaterialon Board Previous Cost $287,189

Daily Daily 588 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $19.573

Cum. 7.8 hrs Cum. 7158 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

MPPI MSC Exploration
' Daily OrillingRåliört

Block. Lease and Well No. Contract Ria Ofg Date on I ocation Soud Date Report Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 17 16 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 13, 2004

MR TVD Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth.TD. Company Repreëentative

3,391 3,391 527 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operatiori Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People onLoc.: 15 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: LJ Y•s Ü No LC50 Sample Date Operator 1 8/6/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: ProbleA?O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: O No Pass7 L.]Yes U No Service 3 9/6/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 KSS STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED ANbHIDRAULICS RÊt.ORD

BIT BitType and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

5 77/8" HTCGTS18 5041747 12,13,13 2,864'52T 191/280 25/35 27.0

BitRempiks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

120.ib 9A 82 88

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4 48 180

1 9 x 6 3.15 120 378 1500 337 255 t/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA

ILength: 585' Description: bit, 1- bit sub (3.22'), 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.85'), 1 IBS (3.90'), 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.845), 1- IBS (3.07'), 10 - DC 6 1/4" (306.19')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT 8.8 41 14 16 2/15 7 2 0.3 0.25 9 9 0.2 .08/.33

Smpi I-.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

iI A0000 180 $9 89 #1 #2 Desand Cent.

K 2% 145 145 24 John Umon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECÝIONAL SU tVEYŠ
145 24 52,928 519,964

MD TVD ANGLE Direction Coordinates VS DL CLOSURE

3064 6064 3.50 *

OPERATIONSSU.1MARY
Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 1000 4.0 25 Wash and ream 2683' to 2864' Time St mmary

1000 1730 7.5 5 Drillingwith LSND mud 2864' - 3084' Activity Daily Cum.

1730 1800 0.5 20 Survey g 3064' - 3.5 deg 1. Mob/DeMob 75

1800 0600 12.0 5 Drillingwith LSND mud to 3391' 2. Cement 2.5

3. Circulate 8.5

4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 19.5 120.75

6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging

Formation Mancos Shale - surface to Dakota sd 9. Lost Circ.

Dakota Sand stone. - 2230' 10. DrillCmt./LOT 3

Morrison - 2460' 11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13

13. P.U./L.D. Pipe

No gas readings available 14. R/U; R/D 2.5

15. Rig Repair 7.75

16. Run Casing 6.5

17. Service Rip 2
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey 0.5 4

21. Trips 15
22. Tst. BOPs 5
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.

RECEIVEI) 25.Wash&Ream 4 16

26. Well Control

Total 24 337.25

Total dours 24.0
RIq Downtime Fuel Usage BulkMaterialon Board Previous Cost $287,189

Daily Daily 588 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $19.573

Cum. 7.8 hrs Cum. 7158 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block,Leage an¢ WellN9. Contract Ria g Qig Date on Location SDud Date Reoort Date
F Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 1ß 15 . 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 12, 2004

m Ty.Q Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative
2,864 2,864 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Ope¶ation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
Washing & Reaming to bottom Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 ast BOP Test Date RIGELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50Sample Dpte Operator 1 6/6/2004 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem7 U Yes Contractor 11 ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? O Yes _ No Service 2 9/6/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth LinerTop MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 KSS STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED ANDHIDRAULICSREt,ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets D th in Footage Hrs WOB R ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

4RR 77/8" MarquisC683G mb78112 open 1,14T 1,717' 281/22/3 40 60.2 Re-usable
5 77/8" HTCGTS18 5041747 12,13,13 2,864'

Bit Remarks: Bit #4RR willbe re-usable on the next Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
well. . 101.26

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 120 378 1400 337 255 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 585' Description: bit, 1- bit sub (3.22'), 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.85'), 1 IBS (3.90'), 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.845) 1- IBS (3.07'), 10 - DC 6 1/4" (306.19')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'),6- 61/4" DC (176.18')

Smpi RL
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PII 2000 80 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
145 145 John Limon M-I
#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost CumulativeCost
145 42,964 $12,036

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD VS

)PERATIONS SUA MARY
TIEAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0830 2.5 3 Circulate air to hole. Wait for hole to unload Time St mmary
0830 1100 2.5 21 TOOH. LD air hammer Activity Daily Cum.
1100 1430 3.5 28 Build mud volume. Mix mud 1. Mob/DeMob 75
1430 1630 2.0 21 GlH with bit 2200'. 2. Cement 2.5
1630 1730 1.0 3 Circulate bottoms up @2200' 3. Circulate 3.5 8.5
1730 1800 0.5 21 GlH tag fill2501' 4. Directional Work
1800 0600 12.0 25 Wash and ream to bottom 5. Drilling 101.25

6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt.lLOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5
15. Rig Repair 7.75
16. Run Casing 6.5
17. Service Rig 2
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey 3.5
21. Trips 5 15
22. Tst. BOPs 5
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream 12 12
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 3.5 43.25

Total 24 313.25
Total iours 24.0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage BulkMaterial on Board Previous Cost $255,127
Daily Daily 650 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $32,062Cum. 7.8 hrs Cum. 6570 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

PPI MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block,Leage an¢ WellN9. Contract Ria g Qig Date on Location SDud Date Reoort Date
F Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 1ß 15 . 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 12, 2004

m Ty.Q Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative
2,864 2,864 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Ope¶ation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
Washing & Reaming to bottom Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 ast BOP Test Date RIGELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50Sample Dpte Operator 1 6/6/2004 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem7 U Yes Contractor 11 ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? O Yes _ No Service 2 9/6/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth LinerTop MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 KSS STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED ANDHIDRAULICSREt,ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets D th in Footage Hrs WOB R ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

4RR 77/8" MarquisC683G mb78112 open 1,14T 1,717' 281/22/3 40 60.2 Re-usable
5 77/8" HTCGTS18 5041747 12,13,13 2,864'

Bit Remarks: Bit #4RR willbe re-usable on the next Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
well. . 101.26

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 120 378 1400 337 255 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 585' Description: bit, 1- bit sub (3.22'), 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.85'), 1 IBS (3.90'), 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.845) 1- IBS (3.07'), 10 - DC 6 1/4" (306.19')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'),6- 61/4" DC (176.18')

Smpi RL
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PII 2000 80 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
145 145 John Limon M-I
#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost CumulativeCost
145 42,964 $12,036

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD VS

)PERATIONS SUA MARY
TIEAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0830 2.5 3 Circulate air to hole. Wait for hole to unload Time St mmary
0830 1100 2.5 21 TOOH. LD air hammer Activity Daily Cum.
1100 1430 3.5 28 Build mud volume. Mix mud 1. Mob/DeMob 75
1430 1630 2.0 21 GlH with bit 2200'. 2. Cement 2.5
1630 1730 1.0 3 Circulate bottoms up @2200' 3. Circulate 3.5 8.5
1730 1800 0.5 21 GlH tag fill2501' 4. Directional Work
1800 0600 12.0 25 Wash and ream to bottom 5. Drilling 101.25

6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt.lLOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5
15. Rig Repair 7.75
16. Run Casing 6.5
17. Service Rig 2
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey 3.5
21. Trips 5 15
22. Tst. BOPs 5
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream 12 12
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 3.5 43.25

Total 24 313.25
Total iours 24.0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage BulkMaterial on Board Previous Cost $255,127
Daily Daily 650 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $32,062Cum. 7.8 hrs Cum. 6570 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



MPPI MSC Exploration
no o ' ally Drilling Report

Block.Lease andWellNo. Contract Rio D.QL Og Date onLocation Soud Date Reoort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 19 18 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 15, 2004

MR R Footage AFSNo. AFEAmount Auth.TD, Compa ly Representative

4,612 4,612 412 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present ODeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Tripfor newbit Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Cunent Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 15 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes [__\No LCSC Sample Date Operator 1 8/6/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: __
No Pass7 Q Yes UNo Service 3 9/6/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Alr

Surface 8 S/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT,GPEED AND HIDRAULICSREt ORD
BIT BIt Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

5 7 7/8" HTC GTS18 5041747 12,13,13 2,864' 1,748' 62 1/4 35/38 80 28.1

BitRemarks; Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

163.6 11b 9 I 10b

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 Pump #3

Aps DC DP 1/4 48 180

1 9x6 3.15 120 378 1550 294 179 1/2 60 350

2 9x6 3.15 3/4 75 680

BHA
Length: 685' Description: bit, 1- bit sub (3.22'), 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.85'), 1 IBS (3.90'), 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.845), 1- IBS (3.0T), 10 - DC 6 1/4" (306.19')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6-61/4" DC (176.18')

MUD DATA
WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT 8.8 40 11 11 8/13 8.4 2 3 0.25 9.5 9.5 0.25 .1/.32

Smpl l-.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

fl 1000 80 00 119 #1 #2 Desand Cent.

2% KCI 145 145 24 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Deslit Mud CI Dally Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONALSU tvEYS
145 24 $2,A2 $25,169

MD TVD ANGLE Direction Coordinates VS DL CLOSURE

4284 4284 4.00 *

4552 4552 4.00 *

OPERATIONSSUtiMARY

iAL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0930 3.5 5 Drillingto 4316' Time St mmary

0930 1000 0.5 20 Survey 4284' 4 deg Activity Daily Cum,

1000 1100 1.0 17 Service rig and repair rig transmission 1. Mob/DeMob 75

1100 0200 15,0 5 Drillingto 4594' 2. Cement 2.5

0200 0300 1.0 20 Circulate and survey 4552' 4 deg 3. Circulate 8.5

0300 0415 1.3 5 Drillingto 4612' 4. Directional Work

0415 0600 1.8 21 Pump pilland TOOH. Will run mud motor. 5. Drilling 19.75 163.5
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing

Shows: 8. OH Logging

4116'-4310' , (194') SI-med yellowring 9. Lost Circ.

4490'-4540' (50') B=9 u, D = 15 u 10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.

Formation Mancos Shale•surface 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13

Dakota Sand stone. - 2230' 13. P.U./L.D.Pipe

Morrison- 2460' 14. R/U;R/D 2.5

Curtis/Moab tongue - 3096' 15. Rig Repair 7.75

Entrada - 3262' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Carmel - 3612' 17. Service Rig 1 3

Navajo - 3684' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Kayenta - 4104' 19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey 1.5 6.5
21. Trips 1.75 16.75

BG = 0 - 10 units 22. Tst. BOPs 5

CG = 0 units 23. UR/HO

TG-Ounits N EIVCa 24.W.O.W.

Max FG 15 units L./ 25. Wash & Ream 16
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 43.25

. Û Total 24 385.25
Total fours 24.0 Qg

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $394,403

Daily Daily 1050 Gals ement: sx DailyCost $27,047

Cum. 7.8 hrs Cum. 9216 Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost

MPPI MSC Exploration
no o ' ally Drilling Report

Block.Lease andWellNo. Contract Rio D.QL Og Date onLocation Soud Date Reoort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 19 18 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 15, 2004

MR R Footage AFSNo. AFEAmount Auth.TD, Compa ly Representative

4,612 4,612 412 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present ODeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Tripfor newbit Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Cunent Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 15 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes [__\No LCSC Sample Date Operator 1 8/6/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: __
No Pass7 Q Yes UNo Service 3 9/6/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Alr

Surface 8 S/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT,GPEED AND HIDRAULICSREt ORD
BIT BIt Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

5 7 7/8" HTC GTS18 5041747 12,13,13 2,864' 1,748' 62 1/4 35/38 80 28.1

BitRemarks; Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

163.6 11b 9 I 10b

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 Pump #3

Aps DC DP 1/4 48 180

1 9x6 3.15 120 378 1550 294 179 1/2 60 350

2 9x6 3.15 3/4 75 680

BHA
Length: 685' Description: bit, 1- bit sub (3.22'), 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.85'), 1 IBS (3.90'), 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.845), 1- IBS (3.0T), 10 - DC 6 1/4" (306.19')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6-61/4" DC (176.18')

MUD DATA
WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT 8.8 40 11 11 8/13 8.4 2 3 0.25 9.5 9.5 0.25 .1/.32

Smpl l-.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

fl 1000 80 00 119 #1 #2 Desand Cent.

2% KCI 145 145 24 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Deslit Mud CI Dally Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONALSU tvEYS
145 24 $2,A2 $25,169

MD TVD ANGLE Direction Coordinates VS DL CLOSURE

4284 4284 4.00 *

4552 4552 4.00 *

OPERATIONSSUtiMARY

iAL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0930 3.5 5 Drillingto 4316' Time St mmary

0930 1000 0.5 20 Survey 4284' 4 deg Activity Daily Cum,

1000 1100 1.0 17 Service rig and repair rig transmission 1. Mob/DeMob 75

1100 0200 15,0 5 Drillingto 4594' 2. Cement 2.5

0200 0300 1.0 20 Circulate and survey 4552' 4 deg 3. Circulate 8.5

0300 0415 1.3 5 Drillingto 4612' 4. Directional Work

0415 0600 1.8 21 Pump pilland TOOH. Will run mud motor. 5. Drilling 19.75 163.5

6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing

Shows: 8. OH Logging

4116'-4310' , (194') SI-med yellowring 9. Lost Circ.

4490'-4540' (50') B=9 u, D = 15 u 10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.

Formation Mancos Shale•surface 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13

Dakota Sand stone. - 2230' 13. P.U./L.D.Pipe

Morrison- 2460' 14. R/U;R/D 2.5

Curtis/Moab tongue - 3096' 15. Rig Repair 7.75

Entrada - 3262' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Carmel - 3612' 17. Service Rig 1 3

Navajo - 3684' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Kayenta - 4104' 19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey 1.5 6.5

21. Trips 1.75 16.75

BG = 0 - 10 units 22. Tst. BOPs 5

CG = 0 units 23. UR/HO

TG-Ounits N EIVCa 24.W.O.W.

Max FG 15 units L./ 25. Wash & Ream 16

26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 43.25

. Û Total 24 385.25

Total fours 24.0 Qg
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $394,403

Daily Daily 1050 Gals ement: sx DailyCost $27,047

Cum. 7.8 hrs Cum. 9216 Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
n Daily Drilling Report

Block, ease and WellNo. ÇontrpetRiq QQL Q_Ë$ Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date
E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 18 17 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 14, 2004

W g Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representytive
4,190 4,190 799 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Preyent Çperatlon Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpysher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 15 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50 Sample Date Operator 1 8/6/04 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 Yes Contractor 11 NextBOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: No Pass? O Yes No Service 3 9/6/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H /DRAULICSRECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
5 7 7/8" HTC GTS18 5041747 12,13,13 2,864' 1,326' 42 1/2 35/30 80 31.2

Bit Remarkg: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

ps DC DP 1/4 48 180
1 9 x 6 3.15 120 378 1550 364 268 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 585' Description: bit, 1- bit sub (3.22'), 1- 6 1/4" DC (30 85'), 1 IBS(3 90'), 1-6 1/4" DC (30.845), 1- IBS (3.07'), 10 - DC 6 1/4" (306.19')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')

Smpi E.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pil 10000 100 90 113 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
KCI = 2% 145 145 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 24 52,753 522,717

MD ANGLE VS CLOSURE
3514 3544 3.00 °

4027 4027 4.00 °

OPERAT ONS SUt1MARY
DIE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0930 3.5 5 Drillingto 3574' Time St mmary
0930 1000 0.5 20 Survey 3544' - 3.0 deg Activity Daily Cum.
1000 0130 15.5 5 Drillingto 4069' 1. Mob/DeMob 75
0130 0200 0.5 20 Survey 4027' - 4.0 deg 2. Cement 2.5
0200 0600 4.0 5 Drilling to 4180' 3. Circulate 8.5

4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 23 143.75
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging

Formation Mancos Shale - surface to Dakota sd 9. Lost Circ.
Dakota Sand stone. - 2230' 10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
Morrison - 2460' 11. N.U./ N.D.
Curtis/Moab tongue - 3096' 12. P.U./LD. BHA 13
Entrada - 3262' 13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
Carmel - 3612' 14. RIU;R/D 2.5
Navahoe - 3684' 15. Rig Repair 7.75
Kayenta - 4104' 16. Run Casing 6.5

17. Service Rig 2
18. Sidetrack Op.

BG = 0 - 7 units 19. Stuck Pipe
CG = 0 units 20. Survey 1 5
TG - 0 units 21. Trips 15
Form G = 0 22. Tst. BOPs 5

23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream 16
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 43.25

Total 24 361.25
Total dours 24.0

Rig Do.vntime Fuel Usage ulk Material on Board revious Cost $306,762
Daily Daily 1008 Gals ement: sx allyCost $87,641Cum. 7.8 hrs Cum. 8166 Gals arite: sx um, Cost

PPI MSC Exploration
n Daily Drilling Report

Block, ease and WellNo. ÇontrpetRiq QQL Q_Ë$ Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date
E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 18 17 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 14, 2004

W g Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representytive
4,190 4,190 799 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Preyent Çperatlon Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpysher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 15 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50 Sample Date Operator 1 8/6/04 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 Yes Contractor 11 NextBOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: No Pass? O Yes No Service 3 9/6/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H /DRAULICSRECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
5 7 7/8" HTC GTS18 5041747 12,13,13 2,864' 1,326' 42 1/2 35/30 80 31.2

Bit Remarkg: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

ps DC DP 1/4 48 180
1 9 x 6 3.15 120 378 1550 364 268 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 585' Description: bit, 1- bit sub (3.22'), 1- 6 1/4" DC (30 85'), 1 IBS(3 90'), 1-6 1/4" DC (30.845), 1- IBS (3.07'), 10 - DC 6 1/4" (306.19')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')

Smpi E.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pil 10000 100 90 113 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
KCI = 2% 145 145 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 24 52,753 522,717

MD ANGLE VS CLOSURE
3514 3544 3.00 °

4027 4027 4.00 °

OPERAT ONS SUt1MARY
DIE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0930 3.5 5 Drillingto 3574' Time St mmary
0930 1000 0.5 20 Survey 3544' - 3.0 deg Activity Daily Cum.
1000 0130 15.5 5 Drillingto 4069' 1. Mob/DeMob 75
0130 0200 0.5 20 Survey 4027' - 4.0 deg 2. Cement 2.5
0200 0600 4.0 5 Drilling to 4180' 3. Circulate 8.5

4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 23 143.75
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging

Formation Mancos Shale - surface to Dakota sd 9. Lost Circ.
Dakota Sand stone. - 2230' 10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
Morrison - 2460' 11. N.U./ N.D.
Curtis/Moab tongue - 3096' 12. P.U./LD. BHA 13
Entrada - 3262' 13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
Carmel - 3612' 14. RIU;R/D 2.5
Navahoe - 3684' 15. Rig Repair 7.75
Kayenta - 4104' 16. Run Casing 6.5

17. Service Rig 2
18. Sidetrack Op.

BG = 0 - 7 units 19. Stuck Pipe
CG = 0 units 20. Survey 1 5
TG - 0 units 21. Trips 15
Form G = 0 22. Tst. BOPs 5

23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream 16
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 43.25

Total 24 361.25
Total dours 24.0

Rig Do.vntime Fuel Usage ulk Material on Board revious Cost $306,762
Daily Daily 1008 Gals ement: sx allyCost $87,641Cum. 7.8 hrs Cum. 8166 Gals arite: sx um, Cost



MPPI MSC Exploration
ne Daily Drilling Ileport

Block. Lease and Well No. Contract Ria & Of,$. Date on Location Soud Date ReDort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 21 20 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 17, 2004

M Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth TD. Company Representative

5,168 5,168 238 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Queration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

WorkingStuck P1pe Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 15 ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: U Yes U No LCSOSampfe Date Operator 1 8/6/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? Ü Yes Contractor 11 ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes No Service 3 9/6/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35° Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 KS5 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT,SPEED AND HIDRAULICSREt ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearíng Gage

6 7 7/8" HTC GX20 5054503 13,14,14 4,612' 556' 19 1/2 30/35 161 28.5

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

163.6 126 1 0 119

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum

gps DC DP 1/4

i 9 x 6 3.15 120 378 1400 300 182 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 611' Description: bit, 1- mud motor (28.64'), 1-IBS (3.07)- 1- 6 1/4" DC (30 BS'), 1 IBS (3.90'), 11 - DC 6 1/4" (337.05')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')

Mudmotor .24* 120 stk= 86 rpm, 54 rot table = 140 rpm on bit

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

0000 120 97 120 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
KCL 2% 145 145 24 John Umon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt MudCI DailyCost Cumulative Cost

145 24 $3,640 30,186

DIRECÝIONALSURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE CLOSURE

5097 5097 3.75 *

OPERATIONSSU,1MARY
.AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 1030 4.5 5 Drilling4930'- 5015' Time St mmary

1030 1230 2.0 21 TOOH for rig repairs to 2476', Tight hole 5018' - 3150' - pull 20/40K over Activity Daily Cum.

2800' - 2700' - pull 20/40K over 1. Mob/DeMob 75

1230 1430 2.0 15 Replaced packing in swivel 2. Cement 2.5

1430 1500 0.5 21 TIH to 2694' 3. Circulate 8,5

1500 1800 3.0 25 Wash and ream from 2694' -2863'
4. Directional Work

1800 1830 0.5 21 TIH to 362T 5. Drilling 10 183

1830 1930 1.0 25 Wash and ream from 362T - 3663' 6. DrivePipe

1930 2000 0.5 21 TIHto 4572' 7. Fishing

2000 2030 0.5 25 Wash and ream 4572' - 4622' 8. OH Logging

2030 2100 0.5 21 TIHto 4943' 9. Lost Circ.

2100 2130 0.5 25 Wash and ream 4943' to bottom 4015' 10. DrillCmt./LOT 3

2130 0300 5.5 5 Drilling5015' to 5168' 11. N.U./ N.D.

0300 0400 1.0 20 Survey 509T - 3.75 deg 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13

0400 0630 1.5 15 Mix&pumppill,workingpipe. Swivellocking up while rotating. Prep TOOH. 13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe

0530 0600 0.5 19 Pipe stuck on bottom. Working stuck pipe 14. R/U; R/D 2.5

15. Rig Repair 3.5 11.25

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 17. Service Rig - 3.5

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5 0.5

Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 20. Survey 1 8

Shinarump - 5060' Moenkopi - 5100' 21. Trips 4 27.25
22. Tst. BOPs 5
23. UR/HO

BG=0-Sunits DECEIV > 24.w.o.w.

CG = 0 units 25. Wash & Ream 5 28

TG - 0 units 26. Well Control

M FG = 0 units 27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 43.25

Total 24 433.25

Total iours 24.0
Rig Dcuntime Fuel Usäge BulkMaterial on Board Previous Cost $462,057

Daily 3.5 hrs Daily 546 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $23,337
Cum. 11.3 hrs Cum. 10308 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

MPPI MSC Exploration
ne Daily Drilling Ileport

Block. Lease and Well No. Contract Ria & Of,$. Date on Location Soud Date ReDort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 21 20 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 17, 2004

M Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth TD. Company Representative

5,168 5,168 238 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Queration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

WorkingStuck P1pe Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 15 ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: U Yes U No LCSOSampfe Date Operator 1 8/6/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? Ü Yes Contractor 11 ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes No Service 3 9/6/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35° Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 KS5 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT,SPEED AND HIDRAULICSREt ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearíng Gage

6 7 7/8" HTC GX20 5054503 13,14,14 4,612' 556' 19 1/2 30/35 161 28.5

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

163.6 126 1 0 119

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum

gps DC DP 1/4

i 9 x 6 3.15 120 378 1400 300 182 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 611' Description: bit, 1- mud motor (28.64'), 1-IBS (3.07)- 1- 6 1/4" DC (30 BS'), 1 IBS (3.90'), 11 - DC 6 1/4" (337.05')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')

Mudmotor .24* 120 stk= 86 rpm, 54 rot table = 140 rpm on bit

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

0000 120 97 120 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
KCL 2% 145 145 24 John Umon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt MudCI DailyCost Cumulative Cost

145 24 $3,640 30,186

DIRECÝIONALSURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE CLOSURE

5097 5097 3.75 *

OPERATIONSSU,1MARY
.AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 1030 4.5 5 Drilling4930'- 5015' Time St mmary

1030 1230 2.0 21 TOOH for rig repairs to 2476', Tight hole 5018' - 3150' - pull 20/40K over Activity Daily Cum.

2800' - 2700' - pull 20/40K over 1. Mob/DeMob 75

1230 1430 2.0 15 Replaced packing in swivel 2. Cement 2.5

1430 1500 0.5 21 TIH to 2694' 3. Circulate 8,5

1500 1800 3.0 25 Wash and ream from 2694' -2863'
4. Directional Work

1800 1830 0.5 21 TIH to 362T 5. Drilling 10 183

1830 1930 1.0 25 Wash and ream from 362T - 3663' 6. DrivePipe

1930 2000 0.5 21 TIHto 4572' 7. Fishing

2000 2030 0.5 25 Wash and ream 4572' - 4622' 8. OH Logging

2030 2100 0.5 21 TIHto 4943' 9. Lost Circ.

2100 2130 0.5 25 Wash and ream 4943' to bottom 4015' 10. DrillCmt./LOT 3

2130 0300 5.5 5 Drilling5015' to 5168' 11. N.U./ N.D.

0300 0400 1.0 20 Survey 509T - 3.75 deg 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13

0400 0630 1.5 15 Mix&pumppill,workingpipe. Swivellocking up while rotating. Prep TOOH. 13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe

0530 0600 0.5 19 Pipe stuck on bottom. Working stuck pipe 14. R/U; R/D 2.5

15. Rig Repair 3.5 11.25

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 17. Service Rig - 3.5

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5 0.5

Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 20. Survey 1 8

Shinarump - 5060' Moenkopi - 5100' 21. Trips 4 27.25

22. Tst. BOPs 5
23. UR/HO

BG=0-Sunits DECEIV > 24.w.o.w.

CG = 0 units 25. Wash & Ream 5 28

TG - 0 units 26. Well Control

M FG = 0 units 27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 43.25

Total 24 433.25

Total iours 24.0
Rig Dcuntime Fuel Usäge BulkMaterial on Board Previous Cost $462,057

Daily 3.5 hrs Daily 546 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $23,337
Cum. 11.3 hrs Cum. 10308 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
ug" Daily Drilling Report

ßlqck,Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria Q.QL RE§. Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date
E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 20 19 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 16, 2004

MOD g Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative
4,930 4,930 318 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Opêration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher
Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 15 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes No LC50 Sample Date Operator 1 8/6/2004 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: No Pass? O Yes O No Service 3 9/6/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT,SPEED ANDHIDRAULICS RELORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
5 7 7/8" HTC GTS18 5041747 12,13,13 2,864' 1,748' 62 1/4 35/38 80 28.1 8 8 1/2
6 7 7/8" HTC GX20 5054603 13,14,14 4,612' 318' 9 1/2 20/30 140 33.5

Bit Remarks: Bit totallydemolished Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROI Wt Torque
163. 22 118 114

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pump #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4 46 300
1 9x6 3.15 120 378 1400 300 182 1/2 75 550
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 611' Description: bit. 1- mud motor (28.64') IBS (3.07)- 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.85'), 1 IBS (3.90'), 11 - DC 6 1/4" (337 05')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')
Mud motor .24* 120 stk= 86 rpm, 54 rot table = 140 rpm on bit

Smpl I-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PI 9000 100 Ub 119 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
KCI 1.8% 145 145 24 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt MudCI DailyCost CumulativeCost
145 24 51,477 $26,646

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS

4853 4853 4.50 °

OPERAT ONS SUPIMARY
4E Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0830 2.5 21 TOOH. Tight hole g 3580°- Pulled 30K over, 3320' - 3180' - 40K over Time St mmary
0830 1130 3.0 21 TIH w/ bit #6 and mud motor Activity Daily Cum.
1130 1700 5.5 25 Wash and ream 2744' to 2962'. 1. Mob/DeMob 75
1700 1800 1.0 21 TlH 2. Cement 2.5
1800 1930 1.5 25 Wash and ream 4480' to 4612' TD. 3. Circulate 8.5
1930 0430 9.0 5 Drilling4612' to 4924' 4. Directional Work
0430 0500 0.5 17 Service rig 5. Drilling 9.5 173
0500 0530 0.5 20 Survey 4853' 4.5 deg 6. Drive Pipe
0530 0600 0.5 5 Drilling to 4930' 7. Fishing

8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.

Shows: No new shows 10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U.I N.D.

Formation Mancos Shale - surface 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
Dakota Sand stone. - 2230' 13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
Morrison - 2460' 14. R/U; R/D 2.5
Curtis/Moab tongue - 3096' 15. Rig Repair 7.75
Entrada - 3262' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Carmel - 3612' 17. Service Rig 0.5 3.5
Navajo - 3684' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Kayenta - 4104' 19. Stuck Pipe
Wingate - 4262' 20. Survey 0.5 7
Chinie - 4708' 21. Trips 6.5 23.25

22. Tst. BOPs 5
23. UR/HO

BG = 0 - 5 units 24. W.O.W.
CG = 0 units 25. Wash & Ream 7 23
TG - 0 units 26. Well Control
M FG = 0 units 27. WOC

28. Other 43.25
Total 24 409.25

Total iours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $421,450

Daily Daily 546 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $40,607Cum. 7.8 hrs Cum. 9762 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

PPI MSC Exploration
ug" Daily Drilling Report

ßlqck,Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria Q.QL RE§. Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date
E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 20 19 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 16, 2004

MOD g Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative
4,930 4,930 318 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Opêration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher
Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 15 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes No LC50 Sample Date Operator 1 8/6/2004 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: No Pass? O Yes O No Service 3 9/6/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT,SPEED ANDHIDRAULICS RELORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
5 7 7/8" HTC GTS18 5041747 12,13,13 2,864' 1,748' 62 1/4 35/38 80 28.1 8 8 1/2
6 7 7/8" HTC GX20 5054603 13,14,14 4,612' 318' 9 1/2 20/30 140 33.5

Bit Remarks: Bit totallydemolished Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROI Wt Torque
163. 22 118 114

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pump #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4 46 300
1 9x6 3.15 120 378 1400 300 182 1/2 75 550
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 611' Description: bit. 1- mud motor (28.64') IBS (3.07)- 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.85'), 1 IBS (3.90'), 11 - DC 6 1/4" (337 05')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')
Mud motor .24* 120 stk= 86 rpm, 54 rot table = 140 rpm on bit

Smpl I-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PI 9000 100 Ub 119 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
KCI 1.8% 145 145 24 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt MudCI DailyCost CumulativeCost
145 24 51,477 $26,646

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS

4853 4853 4.50 °

OPERAT ONS SUPIMARY
4E Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0830 2.5 21 TOOH. Tight hole g 3580°- Pulled 30K over, 3320' - 3180' - 40K over Time St mmary
0830 1130 3.0 21 TIH w/ bit #6 and mud motor Activity Daily Cum.
1130 1700 5.5 25 Wash and ream 2744' to 2962'. 1. Mob/DeMob 75
1700 1800 1.0 21 TlH 2. Cement 2.5
1800 1930 1.5 25 Wash and ream 4480' to 4612' TD. 3. Circulate 8.5
1930 0430 9.0 5 Drilling4612' to 4924' 4. Directional Work
0430 0500 0.5 17 Service rig 5. Drilling 9.5 173
0500 0530 0.5 20 Survey 4853' 4.5 deg 6. Drive Pipe
0530 0600 0.5 5 Drilling to 4930' 7. Fishing

8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.

Shows: No new shows 10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U.I N.D.

Formation Mancos Shale - surface 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
Dakota Sand stone. - 2230' 13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
Morrison - 2460' 14. R/U; R/D 2.5
Curtis/Moab tongue - 3096' 15. Rig Repair 7.75
Entrada - 3262' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Carmel - 3612' 17. Service Rig 0.5 3.5
Navajo - 3684' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Kayenta - 4104' 19. Stuck Pipe
Wingate - 4262' 20. Survey 0.5 7
Chinie - 4708' 21. Trips 6.5 23.25

22. Tst. BOPs 5
23. UR/HO

BG = 0 - 5 units 24. W.O.W.
CG = 0 units 25. Wash & Ream 7 23
TG - 0 units 26. Well Control
M FG = 0 units 27. WOC

28. Other 43.25
Total 24 409.25

Total iours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $421,450

Daily Daily 546 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $40,607Cum. 7.8 hrs Cum. 9762 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



MPPI MSC Exploration
"*i** Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria QQ.L QF Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 23 22 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 19, 2004

MR TVJ Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth.TD. Company Representative

5,825 5,825 439 $827.000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Ooeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Tonipusher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 17 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: LJ Yes U No (.050Sample Date Operator 3 8/6/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes O No Service 3 9/6/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT,SPEED AND HIDRAULICSRELORD
BIT BitType and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

7 7 7/8" HTC GX20 5054765 13,14,14 5,168' 657' 19 1/2 35/38 161 33.7

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

209.6 130 120 125

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #g Pumg_3

ggs DC DP 1/4 47 290

1 9 x 6 3.15 120 378 1400 300 182 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 611' Description: bit, 1- mud motor (28.64'), 1-IBS (3.07)- 1-6 1/4" DC (30.85'), i IBS (3.90'), 11 - DC 6 1/4" (337.05')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')

Mudmotor .24* 120 stk= 86 rpm, 75 rot table= 161 rpm on bit

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT 8.8 43 12 19 12/22 8.3 3.5 0.25 10.4 9.5 0.3 .1/.4

Smpi I-.L.

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PfË 9600 80 96 112 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
KCL 1.9% 145 145 24 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Deslit MudCI DailyCost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIÔNALSU tVEYS
145 24 $3,390 $36,836

MD TVD ANGLE Direction Coordinates VS DL CLOSURE

6315 5316 4.00 *

5407 5407 3.75 *

5618 5618 3.26 '
OPERATIONSSUMMARY

¡AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0630 0.5 5 Drillingto 5386' Time St mmary

0630 0700 0.5 20 Survey 5315'- 4 deg Activity Daily Cum.

0700 0900 2.0 15 Rig repair. Repaired air to drilling clutch 1. Mob/DeMob 75

0900 1330 4.5 5 Drillingto 5478' 2. Cement 2.5

1330 1400 0.5 20 Survey5407' 3.75 deg 3. Circulate 8.5

1400 2300 9.0 5 Drilingto 5693' 4. Directional Work

2300 2330 0.5 20 Survey 5618' 3.25 deg 5. Drilling 19.5 209.5

2330 0400 4.5 5 Driling to 5810' 6. Drive Pipe

0400 0500 1.0 15 Rigrepair, changed swivel packinggland 7. Fishing

0500 0600 1.0 5 Drillingto 5825' 8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt.lLOT 3

11. N.U.] N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13

13. P.U./L.D.Pipe
14. R/U; RID 2.5

MorrisonShale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 3 29.75

Morrison- 2680' Curtis (MoabTongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 4.5

Navojo- 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Wingate - 4375' Chiníe - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5

Shinarump - 5060' Moenkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 1.5 10

21. Trips 27.25

2ž. Tst. BOPs 5

No New Shows RECOy ,
23. UR/HO

BG = 0 -5 units 24. W.O.W.

CG = 0 units 25. Wash & Ream 28

TG - 0 unus DECI a 26. Well Control

MFG = 0 units 27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 43.25

Total 24 481.25

Total lours 24.0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $511,236

Daily 3.0 hrs Daily 798 Gals ement: sx DailyCost $23,230
Cum. 29.8 hrs Cum. 11526 Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost

MPPI MSC Exploration
"*i** Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria QQ.L QF Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 23 22 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 19, 2004

MR TVJ Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth.TD. Company Representative

5,825 5,825 439 $827.000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Ooeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Tonipusher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 17 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: LJ Yes U No (.050Sample Date Operator 3 8/6/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes O No Service 3 9/6/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT,SPEED AND HIDRAULICSRELORD
BIT BitType and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

7 7 7/8" HTC GX20 5054765 13,14,14 5,168' 657' 19 1/2 35/38 161 33.7

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

209.6 130 120 125

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #g Pumg_3

ggs DC DP 1/4 47 290

1 9 x 6 3.15 120 378 1400 300 182 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 611' Description: bit, 1- mud motor (28.64'), 1-IBS (3.07)- 1-6 1/4" DC (30.85'), i IBS (3.90'), 11 - DC 6 1/4" (337.05')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')

Mudmotor .24* 120 stk= 86 rpm, 75 rot table= 161 rpm on bit

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT 8.8 43 12 19 12/22 8.3 3.5 0.25 10.4 9.5 0.3 .1/.4

Smpi I-.L.

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PfË 9600 80 96 112 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
KCL 1.9% 145 145 24 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Deslit MudCI DailyCost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIÔNALSU tVEYS
145 24 $3,390 $36,836

MD TVD ANGLE Direction Coordinates VS DL CLOSURE

6315 5316 4.00 *

5407 5407 3.75 *

5618 5618 3.26 '
OPERATIONSSUMMARY

¡AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0630 0.5 5 Drillingto 5386' Time St mmary

0630 0700 0.5 20 Survey 5315'- 4 deg Activity Daily Cum.

0700 0900 2.0 15 Rig repair. Repaired air to drilling clutch 1. Mob/DeMob 75

0900 1330 4.5 5 Drillingto 5478' 2. Cement 2.5

1330 1400 0.5 20 Survey5407' 3.75 deg 3. Circulate 8.5

1400 2300 9.0 5 Drilingto 5693' 4. Directional Work

2300 2330 0.5 20 Survey 5618' 3.25 deg 5. Drilling 19.5 209.5

2330 0400 4.5 5 Driling to 5810' 6. Drive Pipe

0400 0500 1.0 15 Rigrepair, changed swivel packinggland 7. Fishing

0500 0600 1.0 5 Drillingto 5825' 8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt.lLOT 3

11. N.U.] N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13

13. P.U./L.D.Pipe
14. R/U; RID 2.5

MorrisonShale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 3 29.75

Morrison- 2680' Curtis (MoabTongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 4.5

Navojo- 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Wingate - 4375' Chiníe - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5

Shinarump - 5060' Moenkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 1.5 10

21. Trips 27.25

2ž. Tst. BOPs 5

No New Shows RECOy ,
23. UR/HO

BG = 0 -5 units 24. W.O.W.

CG = 0 units 25. Wash & Ream 28

TG - 0 unus DECI a 26. Well Control

MFG = 0 units 27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 43.25

Total 24 481.25

Total lours 24.0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $511,236

Daily 3.0 hrs Daily 798 Gals ement: sx DailyCost $23,230
Cum. 29.8 hrs Cum. 11526 Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Explorationne '
Daily Drilling Report

Block. Legse gnd WellNg. Contract Ria & _DIFg Date on Location Soud Date Report Opte
E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 22 21 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 18, 2004

M_Q [VQ Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Represêntative
5,386 5.386 200 $627,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Progent Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

|Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 17 ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LCSO Sample Date Operator 3 8/6/2004 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 ext BOPTest Date ater Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? O Yes O No Service 3 9/6/2004 KB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth LinerTop MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT, SPEED AND HiDRAULICS REGORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Foota e Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
6 7 7/8" HTC GX20 5054503 13,14,14 4,612' 656' 19 1/2 30/35 161 28.6 3 3 I
7 7 7/8" HTC GX20 5054765 13,14,14 5,168' 200' 7 30/36 161 28.6

Bit Remarks: 1 row completelygone on outer heel row Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROl Wt Torque
1- cone loose, not tight. Hughes to look at problem 163.6 Ï2e 1 0 1Ï9
Pump Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3
gps DC DP 1/4

1 9x6 3.15 120 378 1400 300 182 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 611' Description: bit, 1- mud motor (28.64'), 1-IBS (3.07)- 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.85'), i IBS (3.90'), 11 - DC 6 1/4" (337.05')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')
Mud motor .24* 120 stk= 86 rpm, 54 rot table = 140 rpm on bit

Smpi F.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PIÌ 9800 80 98 112 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
1 9% CL 145 145 8 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud Ci Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 8 42,260 $32,446

MD TVD ANGLE VS
5187 5187 4.00 °

iPERATIONS SUN MARY
TIEAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0700 1.0 15 Working Stuck pipe Time St mmary
0700 1230 5.5 15 TOOH. Moderate tighthole from 5050' tp 4045' - 5-20K over Activity Daily Cum.
1230 1500 2.5 15 Change out kelly swivel 1. Mob/DeMob 75
1500 1600 1.0 17 Service rig 2. Cement 2.5
1600 2000 4.0 15 TIH with bit #7 to 5078'. Hole clean 3. Circulate 8.5
2000 2100 1.0 15 Pack kelly swivel 4. Directional Work
2100 2230 1.5 15 Wash and ream 5078' to 5168' 5. Drilling 7 190
2230 0130 3.0 5 Drilling to 5262' 6. Drive Pipe
0130 0200 0.5 20 Survey 5187' 4.0 deg 7. Fishing
0200 0600 4.0 5 Drillingto 5386' 8. OH Logging

9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.

Morrison Shale - O' Dakota 2230' 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 13. P.U./L.D. Pige
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 14. R/U, R/D 2.5
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 15. RigRepair 15.5 26.75
Wingate - 4375' Chinie- 4960' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Shinarump - 5060' Moenkopi - 5100' 17. Service Rig 1 4.5

18. Sidetrack Op.
No New Shows 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
BG = 0 -5 units 20. Survey 0.5 8.5
CG = 0 units 21. Trips 27.25
TG - 0 units 22. Tst. BOPs 5
M FG = 0 units 23. UR/HO

24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream 28
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 43.25

Total iours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $485,394Daily 15.5 hrs Daily 420 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $25,842Cum. 26.8 hrs Cum. 10728 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

PPI MSC Exploration
ne '

Daily Drilling Report
Block. Legse gnd WellNg. Contract Ria & _DIFg Date on Location Soud Date Report Opte

E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 22 21 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 18, 2004
M_Q [VQ Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Represêntative

5,386 5.386 200 $627,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander
Progent Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

|Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 17 ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LCSO Sample Date Operator 3 8/6/2004 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 ext BOPTest Date ater Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? O Yes O No Service 3 9/6/2004 KB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth LinerTop MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT, SPEED AND HiDRAULICS REGORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Foota e Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
6 7 7/8" HTC GX20 5054503 13,14,14 4,612' 656' 19 1/2 30/35 161 28.6 3 3 I
7 7 7/8" HTC GX20 5054765 13,14,14 5,168' 200' 7 30/36 161 28.6

Bit Remarks: 1 row completelygone on outer heel row Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROl Wt Torque
1- cone loose, not tight. Hughes to look at problem 163.6 Ï2e 1 0 1Ï9
Pump Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3
gps DC DP 1/4

1 9x6 3.15 120 378 1400 300 182 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 611' Description: bit, 1- mud motor (28.64'), 1-IBS (3.07)- 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.85'), i IBS (3.90'), 11 - DC 6 1/4" (337.05')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')
Mud motor .24* 120 stk= 86 rpm, 54 rot table = 140 rpm on bit

Smpi F.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PIÌ 9800 80 98 112 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
1 9% CL 145 145 8 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud Ci Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 8 42,260 $32,446

MD TVD ANGLE VS
5187 5187 4.00 °

iPERATIONS SUN MARY
TIEAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0700 1.0 15 Working Stuck pipe Time St mmary
0700 1230 5.5 15 TOOH. Moderate tighthole from 5050' tp 4045' - 5-20K over Activity Daily Cum.
1230 1500 2.5 15 Change out kelly swivel 1. Mob/DeMob 75
1500 1600 1.0 17 Service rig 2. Cement 2.5
1600 2000 4.0 15 TIH with bit #7 to 5078'. Hole clean 3. Circulate 8.5
2000 2100 1.0 15 Pack kelly swivel 4. Directional Work
2100 2230 1.5 15 Wash and ream 5078' to 5168' 5. Drilling 7 190
2230 0130 3.0 5 Drilling to 5262' 6. Drive Pipe
0130 0200 0.5 20 Survey 5187' 4.0 deg 7. Fishing
0200 0600 4.0 5 Drillingto 5386' 8. OH Logging

9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.

Morrison Shale - O' Dakota 2230' 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 13. P.U./L.D. Pige
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 14. R/U, R/D 2.5
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 15. RigRepair 15.5 26.75
Wingate - 4375' Chinie- 4960' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Shinarump - 5060' Moenkopi - 5100' 17. Service Rig 1 4.5

18. Sidetrack Op.
No New Shows 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
BG = 0 -5 units 20. Survey 0.5 8.5
CG = 0 units 21. Trips 27.25
TG - 0 units 22. Tst. BOPs 5
M FG = 0 units 23. UR/HO

24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream 28
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 43.25

Total iours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $485,394Daily 15.5 hrs Daily 420 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $25,842Cum. 26.8 hrs Cum. 10728 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



MPPI MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria Q.Q.L DEg Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date
E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 25 24 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 21, 2004

Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TO. Cempany Repreyentative
6,475 6,475 192 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

ICurrent Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 17 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: Yes O No LC50Sample Date Operator 3 8/6/04 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? U Yes|L_INo Service 3 9/6/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Alr
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WËIGHT, SPEED AND H IDRAULICSRE( ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serlal Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB | Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
777/8"HTCGX20 5054765 13,14,145,168'1,300'601/23 16121.5 8 61/16
8 77/8" HTCGX20 50541663 13,14,14 6,468' 7' 1 30/35 161 7.0

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
2AA.b 140 130 13b

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pump #3

DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 120 378 1580 300 182 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 611' Description:

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')
Mudmotor .24* 120 stk= 86 rpm, 75 rot table = 161 rpm on bit

Smpl P.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

i 10100 42U 8) 120 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2 % KCL 145 145 12 John LImon M-!

#3 #4 Desilt MudCI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONALsuRvavs
145 12 53,596 545,353

MD VS
6208 6208 3.00 °

OPERATONS SUllMARY
AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0630 0.5 5 Drillingto 6283' Time St mmary
0630 0700 0.5 20 Survey 6208' 3 deg Activity Daily Cum.
0700 1730 10.5 5 Drillingto 6468' 1. MoblDeMob 75
1730 1830 1.0 3 Mixand pumppillfor triplooking for washout - DP pressuredropped 2. Cement 2.5
1830 0000 5.5 21 TOOH, lay down one jointwith hole @2860'. 3. Circulate 1 9.5
0000 0430 4.5 21 TlH with bit #8 to 6428' No problems,Hole looks like Cari 4. Directional Work
0430 0500 0.5 25 Wash and ream to bottom 5. Drilling 12 244.5
0500 0600 1.0 5 Drillingto 6475' 6. Drive Pipe

7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3

Working on Centrifuge all night. Worked good for a short time. Waiting 11. N.U./ N.D.
on repairman. 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13

13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. R/U;R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale -0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 29.75
Morrison - 2680' Cuttis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 4.5
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shinarump - 5060' Moenkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 0.5 11.5
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' 21. Trips 10 37.25

22. Tst. BOPs 5
No new shows 23. UR/HO
BG = 0 - 12 units 24. W.O.W.
CG = 0 units 25. Wash & Ream 0.5 28.5
TG -0 units 26. Well Control
M FG = 0 units 27. WOC 12.5

28. Other 43.25
MlW UTotal 24 529.25

Total dours 24.0
Rig Denntime Fuel Usage BulkMaterialon Board Previous Cost $559,814

Daily Daily 505 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $21,191
Cum. 29.8 hrs Cum. 12787 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

MPPI MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria Q.Q.L DEg Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date
E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 25 24 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 21, 2004

Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TO. Cempany Repreyentative
6,475 6,475 192 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

ICurrent Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 17 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: Yes O No LC50Sample Date Operator 3 8/6/04 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? U Yes|L_INo Service 3 9/6/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Alr
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WËIGHT, SPEED AND H IDRAULICSRE( ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serlal Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB | Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
777/8"HTCGX20 5054765 13,14,145,168'1,300'601/23 16121.5 8 61/16
8 77/8" HTCGX20 50541663 13,14,14 6,468' 7' 1 30/35 161 7.0

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
2AA.b 140 130 13b

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pump #3

DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 120 378 1580 300 182 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 611' Description:

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')
Mudmotor .24* 120 stk= 86 rpm, 75 rot table = 161 rpm on bit

Smpl P.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

i 10100 42U 8) 120 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2 % KCL 145 145 12 John LImon M-!

#3 #4 Desilt MudCI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONALsuRvavs
145 12 53,596 545,353

MD VS
6208 6208 3.00 °

OPERATONS SUllMARY
AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0630 0.5 5 Drillingto 6283' Time St mmary
0630 0700 0.5 20 Survey 6208' 3 deg Activity Daily Cum.
0700 1730 10.5 5 Drillingto 6468' 1. MoblDeMob 75
1730 1830 1.0 3 Mixand pumppillfor triplooking for washout - DP pressuredropped 2. Cement 2.5
1830 0000 5.5 21 TOOH, lay down one jointwith hole @2860'. 3. Circulate 1 9.5
0000 0430 4.5 21 TlH with bit #8 to 6428' No problems,Hole looks like Cari 4. Directional Work
0430 0500 0.5 25 Wash and ream to bottom 5. Drilling 12 244.5
0500 0600 1.0 5 Drillingto 6475' 6. Drive Pipe

7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3

Working on Centrifuge all night. Worked good for a short time. Waiting 11. N.U./ N.D.
on repairman. 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13

13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. R/U;R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale -0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 29.75
Morrison - 2680' Cuttis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 4.5
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shinarump - 5060' Moenkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 0.5 11.5
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' 21. Trips 10 37.25

22. Tst. BOPs 5
No new shows 23. UR/HO
BG = 0 - 12 units 24. W.O.W.
CG = 0 units 25. Wash & Ream 0.5 28.5
TG -0 units 26. Well Control
M FG = 0 units 27. WOC 12.5

28. Other 43.25
MlW UTotal 24 529.25

Total dours 24.0
Rig Denntime Fuel Usage BulkMaterialon Board Previous Cost $559,814

Daily Daily 505 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $21,191
Cum. 29.8 hrs Cum. 12787 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease and Well No. Contract Rio R.06 REg Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 24 23 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 20, 2004

MD TV_/D Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Compa ty Representative

6,275 6,275 450 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulalander

Present Ooeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher

Dril1\ng Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 17 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes No LC50Sample Date Operator 3 8/6/2004 RKB 15 ft
¯Šeas:

Problem? Yes Contractor 11 NextBOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: No Pass? O Yes U No Service 3 9/6/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED AND HiDRAULICS RËLORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

7 7 7/8" HTC GX20 5054765 13.14,14 5,168' 1,10T 42 1/2 35/38 161 26.0

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT, Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROl Wt Tor ue

BHA
Length: 611' Description: bit, 1- mud motor (28.64'), 1-IBS(3 07)- 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.85), 1 IBS (3.90'), 11 - DC6 1/4" (337 05')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'),6- 61/4" DC (176.18 )
Mud motor .24* 120 stk= 86 rpm. 75 rot table = 161 rpm on bit

Smpt U.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours MudEngineer Mud Company

Pil 9700 240 96 119 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
KCL 1.9% 145 145 24 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI DailyCost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 24 55,921 541,757

5803 5803 2.75'
5989 5989 2.75 '

OPERAT ONS SUEIMARY
TiiAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0830 2.5 5 Drilling to 5878' Time SL mmary
0830 0900 0.5 20 Sirvey 5038' 2.75 deg Activity Daily Cum.

0900 1930 10.5 5 Drilling to 6064' 1. MoblDeMob 75
1930 2000 0.5 20 Survey 5989' 2.75 deg 2. Cement 2.5
2000 0600 10.0 5 Drillingto 6275' 3. Circulate 8.5

4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 23 232.5
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Loqqing
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.

Mr. Bart Kettle with DONR visited rig. No problems. 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 29.75
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rip 4.5
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta -4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shinarump - 5060' Moenkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 1 11

21. Trips 27.25
Show: 5975' fracture,1 u before, 51 u during, 11 u after 22. Tst. BOPs 5

23. UR/HO
BG = 0 - 11 units 24. W.O.W.
CG = 0 units 25. Wash &Ream 28
TG - 0 units 26. Well Control
M FG = 51 units 27. WOC 12.5

28. Other 43.25
Total 24 505.25

Total lours 24.0
Rig DONntime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $534,466

Daily Daily 756 Gals Cement: sx DailyCost $25,348
Cum. 29.8 hrs Cum. 12282 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

PPI MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease and Well No. Contract Rio R.06 REg Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 24 23 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 20, 2004

MD TV_/D Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Compa ty Representative

6,275 6,275 450 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulalander

Present Ooeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher

Dril1\ng Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 17 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes No LC50Sample Date Operator 3 8/6/2004 RKB 15 ft
¯Šeas:

Problem? Yes Contractor 11 NextBOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: No Pass? O Yes U No Service 3 9/6/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED AND HiDRAULICS RËLORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

7 7 7/8" HTC GX20 5054765 13.14,14 5,168' 1,10T 42 1/2 35/38 161 26.0

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT, Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROl Wt Tor ue

BHA
Length: 611' Description: bit, 1- mud motor (28.64'), 1-IBS(3 07)- 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.85), 1 IBS (3.90'), 11 - DC6 1/4" (337 05')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'),6- 61/4" DC (176.18 )
Mud motor .24* 120 stk= 86 rpm. 75 rot table = 161 rpm on bit

Smpt U.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours MudEngineer Mud Company

Pil 9700 240 96 119 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
KCL 1.9% 145 145 24 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI DailyCost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 24 55,921 541,757

5803 5803 2.75'
5989 5989 2.75 '

OPERAT ONS SUEIMARY
TiiAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0830 2.5 5 Drilling to 5878' Time SL mmary
0830 0900 0.5 20 Sirvey 5038' 2.75 deg Activity Daily Cum.

0900 1930 10.5 5 Drilling to 6064' 1. MoblDeMob 75
1930 2000 0.5 20 Survey 5989' 2.75 deg 2. Cement 2.5
2000 0600 10.0 5 Drillingto 6275' 3. Circulate 8.5

4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 23 232.5
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Loqqing
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.

Mr. Bart Kettle with DONR visited rig. No problems. 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 29.75
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rip 4.5
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta -4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shinarump - 5060' Moenkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 1 11

21. Trips 27.25
Show: 5975' fracture,1 u before, 51 u during, 11 u after 22. Tst. BOPs 5

23. UR/HO
BG = 0 - 11 units 24. W.O.W.
CG = 0 units 25. Wash &Ream 28
TG - 0 units 26. Well Control
M FG = 51 units 27. WOC 12.5

28. Other 43.25
Total 24 505.25

Total lours 24.0
Rig DONntime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $534,466

Daily Daily 756 Gals Cement: sx DailyCost $25,348
Cum. 29.8 hrs Cum. 12282 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



MPPI MSC Exploration
Tgnolof Daily Drilling Report

Block. Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria QQL QFF Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date
E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 28 27 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 24, 2004

M.D TV_D Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth: TD. Company Representative
6,962 6,962 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Ooeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
GIH withconcave mill Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPD S People on Loc.: 1 Last OP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

WInd: Yes / No le Dat Operator 3 8/6/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sk : No Pass7 Yes No Service 3 9/6/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HibRAULICS REt,ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

7" Magnet
7-7/8" Concave Mill

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt RO3 Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

s DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 583.06' Description: mill(2.45'), junk basket(3.22'), bit sub (3.11'), 12 - DC 6 1/4" (367.85')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')- Junkbasket OD = 6 5/8"
Mud motor .24* 120 stk= 86 rpm. 80 rot table = 166 rpm on bit

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pil 10000 680 (0 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2% KCL 145 145 18 John Limon M-i

#3 #4 Deslit Mud CI Dally Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONALSURVEYS
145 24 $967 $62,633

OPERATONS SU 1MARY
ThAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1100 5.0 7 WO tools Time St mmary
1100 1200 1.0 7 MU fishing tools, 7" magnet, junk basket Activity Daily Cum.
1200 1900 7.0 7 TIH with fishing tools 1. Mob/DeMob 75
1900 2000 1.0 7 Circulate bottoms up and fish for bit junk 2. Cement 2.5
2000 0100 5.0 7 TOOH w/ magnet. Chained out 3. Circulate 9.5
0100 0230 1.5 7 Cleaned junk basket and magnet. Recovered 12 pieces of bit junk. 4. Directional Work

MU mill &junkbasket. 5. Drilling 280
0230 0600 3.5 7 TlH with mill 6. Drive Pipe

7. Fishing 24 34
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale -0' Dakota2230' 15. RigRepair 29.75
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 4.5
Navojo- 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shinarump - 5060' Moenkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 14
Moetikopi(Sinbad) 6405' 21. T'rips 37.25

22. Tst. BOPs 5
No new shows 23. UR/HO
BG=0-12units RECEIVCp 24.W.O.W.
CG = 29 units L/ 25. Wash & Ream 28.5
TG - 0 units 26. Well Control
M FG = 0 units 27. WOC 12.5

28. Other 43.25

N OFnu e Total 24 601.25
Total lours 24.0

RIg Dcuntime Fuel Usage BulkMaterial on Board Previous Cost $629,464
Daily Daily 294 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $17,393
Cum. 29.8 hrs Cum. 15160 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

MPPI MSC Exploration
Tgnolof Daily Drilling Report

Block. Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria QQL QFF Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date
E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 28 27 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 24, 2004

M.D TV_D Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth: TD. Company Representative
6,962 6,962 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Ooeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
GIH withconcave mill Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPD S People on Loc.: 1 Last OP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

WInd: Yes / No le Dat Operator 3 8/6/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sk : No Pass7 Yes No Service 3 9/6/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HibRAULICS REt,ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

7" Magnet
7-7/8" Concave Mill

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt RO3 Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

s DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 583.06' Description: mill(2.45'), junk basket(3.22'), bit sub (3.11'), 12 - DC 6 1/4" (367.85')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')- Junkbasket OD = 6 5/8"
Mud motor .24* 120 stk= 86 rpm. 80 rot table = 166 rpm on bit

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pil 10000 680 (0 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2% KCL 145 145 18 John Limon M-i

#3 #4 Deslit Mud CI Dally Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONALSURVEYS
145 24 $967 $62,633

OPERATONS SU 1MARY
ThAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1100 5.0 7 WO tools Time St mmary
1100 1200 1.0 7 MU fishing tools, 7" magnet, junk basket Activity Daily Cum.
1200 1900 7.0 7 TIH with fishing tools 1. Mob/DeMob 75
1900 2000 1.0 7 Circulate bottoms up and fish for bit junk 2. Cement 2.5
2000 0100 5.0 7 TOOH w/ magnet. Chained out 3. Circulate 9.5
0100 0230 1.5 7 Cleaned junk basket and magnet. Recovered 12 pieces of bit junk. 4. Directional Work

MU mill &junkbasket. 5. Drilling 280
0230 0600 3.5 7 TlH with mill 6. Drive Pipe

7. Fishing 24 34
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale -0' Dakota2230' 15. RigRepair 29.75
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 4.5
Navojo- 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shinarump - 5060' Moenkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 14
Moetikopi(Sinbad) 6405' 21. T'rips 37.25

22. Tst. BOPs 5
No new shows 23. UR/HO
BG=0-12units RECEIVCp 24.W.O.W.
CG = 29 units L/ 25. Wash & Ream 28.5
TG - 0 units 26. Well Control
M FG = 0 units 27. WOC 12.5

28. Other 43.25

N OFnu e Total 24 601.25
Total lours 24.0

RIg Dcuntime Fuel Usage BulkMaterial on Board Previous Cost $629,464
Daily Daily 294 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $17,393
Cum. 29.8 hrs Cum. 15160 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
no o* Daily Drilling Report

lock, Lease gnd WellNg. Contract Ria QOL RES Date on j neation Soud Date Report Date

E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 26 25 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 22, 2004

Footage AFE No. AFE Amognt Auth. TD. Compa ly Representative

6,830 6,830 355 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present ODeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 17 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes

__|

No LC50Sample Date Operator 3 8/6/04 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: No Pass? O Yes O No Service 3 9/6/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICSREC ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
8 77/8" HTCGX20 60541663 13,14,14 6,468' 362' 23 35/25 166 15.7

Bit Remarkg: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
266.6 A40 1 0 136

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM

gps 1/4 46 340
1 9 x 6 3.15 120 378 1890 292 177 1/2 64 600
2 9 x 6 3.15 | 3/4

BHA
Length: 611' Description:

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')
Mud motor .24* 120 stk= 86 rpm, 80 rot table = 166 rpm on bit

smpi P.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer MudCompany

ÞIÏ BTU0 480 98 120 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
1.8% KCL 145 145 6 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 24 52,651 548,004

MD VS
6424 6424 3.00 *

5/5.25
OPERATONS SUtiMARY

TiinE TIme Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:
HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0700 1.0 5 Drillingto 6499' TimeSt mmary
0700 0730 0.5 20 Survey 6424' 3 deg Activity Daily Cum.
0730 1530 8.0 5 Drilling to 6683' 1. Mob/DeMob 75
1530 1630 1.0 20 Survey 6608, 5 deg 2. Cement 2.5
1630 0030 8.0 5 Drilling to 6674' Reduced wt to 25K, rpm 161 3. Circulate 9.5
0030 0100 0.5 20 Survey 6699' 5.25 deg 4. Directional Work
0100 0600 5.0 5 Drilling to 6830 S. Drilling 22 266.5

6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. R/U; RID 2.5

Morrison Shale -0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 29.75
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 4.5
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shinarump - 5060' Moenkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 2 13.5
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' 2

22. Tst. BOPs 5
No new shows 23. UR/HO
BG = 0 - 12 units 24. W.O.W.
CG = 0 units 25. Wash & Ream 28.5
TG - 0 units 26. Well Control
M FG = 0 units 27. WOC 12.5

28. Other 43.25

Total dours 24.0
Total 24 553.25

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $581,005
Daily Daily 1176 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $23,416
Cum. 29.8 hrs Cum. 13963 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

PPI MSC Exploration
no o* Daily Drilling Report

lock, Lease gnd WellNg. Contract Ria QOL RES Date on j neation Soud Date Report Date

E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 26 25 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 22, 2004

Footage AFE No. AFE Amognt Auth. TD. Compa ly Representative

6,830 6,830 355 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present ODeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 17 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes
__|

No LC50Sample Date Operator 3 8/6/04 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: No Pass? O Yes O No Service 3 9/6/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICSREC ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

8 77/8" HTCGX20 60541663 13,14,14 6,468' 362' 23 35/25 166 15.7

Bit Remarkg: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
266.6 A40 1 0 136

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM

gps 1/4 46 340
1 9 x 6 3.15 120 378 1890 292 177 1/2 64 600
2 9 x 6 3.15 | 3/4

BHA
Length: 611' Description:

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')
Mud motor .24* 120 stk= 86 rpm, 80 rot table = 166 rpm on bit

smpi P.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer MudCompany

ÞIÏ BTU0 480 98 120 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
1.8% KCL 145 145 6 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 24 52,651 548,004

MD VS
6424 6424 3.00 *

5/5.25
OPERATONS SUtiMARY

TiinE TIme Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:
HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0700 1.0 5 Drillingto 6499' TimeSt mmary
0700 0730 0.5 20 Survey 6424' 3 deg Activity Daily Cum.
0730 1530 8.0 5 Drilling to 6683' 1. Mob/DeMob 75
1530 1630 1.0 20 Survey 6608, 5 deg 2. Cement 2.5
1630 0030 8.0 5 Drilling to 6674' Reduced wt to 25K, rpm 161 3. Circulate 9.5
0030 0100 0.5 20 Survey 6699' 5.25 deg 4. Directional Work
0100 0600 5.0 5 Drilling to 6830 S. Drilling 22 266.5

6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. R/U; RID 2.5

Morrison Shale -0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 29.75
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 4.5
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shinarump - 5060' Moenkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 2 13.5
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' 2

22. Tst. BOPs 5
No new shows 23. UR/HO
BG = 0 - 12 units 24. W.O.W.
CG = 0 units 25. Wash & Ream 28.5
TG - 0 units 26. Well Control
M FG = 0 units 27. WOC 12.5

28. Other 43.25

Total dours 24.0
Total 24 553.25

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $581,005
Daily Daily 1176 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $23,416
Cum. 29.8 hrs Cum. 13963 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
no Daily DrH11ngReport

Block. Lease and Well No. Contract RIO g Qf.g Date on Location Soud Date Renoit Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union 97 29 28 7/27/04 Jul28, 2004 Aug 25, 2004

gg B Eggggg & AFE Amount Auth. TD. Comna iv Reoresentative

7.002 7,002 40 $827,000 8,500' Cad Hulslander

Present Queration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Ddiling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc : 15 ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes No LCSO SamDie Date Operator 2 8Æl04 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 ext BOP Test Date Water Depth !!

Sky: O No Pass? O Yes No Service 2 9/6/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD WL Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4 24 LP Weki 2 35 35 Alr

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513 513 8 4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HYDRAULICS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Sedal Number Jets De th in Footane Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

9 7 7/6 Hughes HR-S35 5025771 14,14.15 6 964 40 5 25/28 116 8 0

Bit Remarks Cum ROT Hrs PU WL SO Wt ROT Wt Tor ue

BHA
Length: 611 Description:

1-61/4" ars(3023),6-61/4"DC(17618)
Mud motor .24* 120 stk= 86 rpm, 30 rot table = 116 rpm on bit

Smpi F.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PfË 10000 680 10 01 #2 Desand Cent
2% KCL 1À5 145 2À John Limon I

83 #4 pesilt Mud Cl Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

145 24 $2,1/2 454,805

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD VS CLOSURE

OPERA i ONS SU.iMARY
IAL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0700 1.0 7 TlHwith 7 7/8" miliconcavemill Time Semmary
0700 1400 7.0 7 Millon bit parts, Drilled4' Activity Daily Cum
1400 1900 5.0 7 TOOH with mill.Millsmoolhon outside, nodamage, No junkin basket 1 Mob/DeMob 75
1900 0000 5.0 7 Pick up new motor andbit #9. TIHto 6926' 2 Cement 2.5
0000 0100 1.0 7 Wash and ream 6925' to 6962' 3 Circulate 9.5
015 0600 5.0 5 Drining6962' to 7002' 4 Directional Work

5 Drilling 5 285
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 19 53
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10 DrillCmt.lLOT 3
11 N.U.I N.D.
12 P.U.lL.D. BHA 13
13 P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14 RIU;RID 2.5

Morrison Shale -0 Dakota 2230' 15 Rig Repair 29.75
Moirison -2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16 Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684 17 Service Rig 4.5
Navojo - 3843 Kayenta - 4098 18 Sidetrack Op.
Wngate - 4375' Chinie - 4960 19 Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shinatump - 5060 Moenkopi - 510& 20 Survey 14
Moonkopi (Sinbad) 6405' 21 Trips 37.25

22 Tst. BOPs 5
No new shows 23 UR/HO
BG=2-12units 24 WO.W
CG = 0 units 25 Wash & Ream 28.5
TG - 90 units 26 Well Control
M FG = 0 units 27 WOC 12.5

28 Other 43.25

Total 24 625.25
Total lours 24 0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $646,857
Daily Daily 880 Gals Coment: 8x Daily Cost $33,240
Cum. 29.8 his Cum. 16040 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

PPI MSC Exploration
no Daily DrH11ngReport

Block. Lease and Well No. Contract RIO g Qf.g Date on Location Soud Date Renoit Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union 97 29 28 7/27/04 Jul28, 2004 Aug 25, 2004

gg B Eggggg & AFE Amount Auth. TD. Comna iv Reoresentative

7.002 7,002 40 $827,000 8,500' Cad Hulslander

Present Queration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Ddiling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc : 15 ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes No LCSO SamDie Date Operator 2 8Æl04 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 ext BOP Test Date Water Depth !!

Sky: O No Pass? O Yes No Service 2 9/6/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD WL Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4 24 LP Weki 2 35 35 Alr

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513 513 8 4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HYDRAULICS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Sedal Number Jets De th in Footane Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

9 7 7/6 Hughes HR-S35 5025771 14,14.15 6 964 40 5 25/28 116 8 0

Bit Remarks Cum ROT Hrs PU WL SO Wt ROT Wt Tor ue

BHA
Length: 611 Description:

1-61/4" ars(3023),6-61/4"DC(17618)
Mud motor .24* 120 stk= 86 rpm, 30 rot table = 116 rpm on bit

Smpi F.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PfË 10000 680 10 01 #2 Desand Cent
2% KCL 1À5 145 2À John Limon I

83 #4 pesilt Mud Cl Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

145 24 $2,1/2 454,805

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD VS CLOSURE

OPERA i ONS SU.iMARY
IAL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0700 1.0 7 TlHwith 7 7/8" miliconcavemill Time Semmary
0700 1400 7.0 7 Millon bit parts, Drilled4' Activity Daily Cum
1400 1900 5.0 7 TOOH with mill.Millsmoolhon outside, nodamage, No junkin basket 1 Mob/DeMob 75
1900 0000 5.0 7 Pick up new motor andbit #9. TIHto 6926' 2 Cement 2.5
0000 0100 1.0 7 Wash and ream 6925' to 6962' 3 Circulate 9.5
015 0600 5.0 5 Drining6962' to 7002' 4 Directional Work

5 Drilling 5 285
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 19 53
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10 DrillCmt.lLOT 3
11 N.U.I N.D.
12 P.U.lL.D. BHA 13
13 P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14 RIU;RID 2.5

Morrison Shale -0 Dakota 2230' 15 Rig Repair 29.75
Moirison -2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16 Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684 17 Service Rig 4.5
Navojo - 3843 Kayenta - 4098 18 Sidetrack Op.
Wngate - 4375' Chinie - 4960 19 Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shinatump - 5060 Moenkopi - 510& 20 Survey 14
Moonkopi (Sinbad) 6405' 21 Trips 37.25

22 Tst. BOPs 5
No new shows 23 UR/HO
BG=2-12units 24 WO.W
CG = 0 units 25 Wash & Ream 28.5
TG - 90 units 26 Well Control
M FG = 0 units 27 WOC 12.5

28 Other 43.25

Total 24 625.25
Total lours 24 0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $646,857
Daily Daily 880 Gals Coment: 8x Daily Cost $33,240
Cum. 29.8 his Cum. 16040 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration- nå Daily Drilling Report
Block. Lease and Wel No. Contract Rio Q.OJ. OfFE Date on Location Soud Date Renod Date

E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 31 30 7/27N4 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 27, 2004

MD M ERRiißt B AFE Amount Auth. TD. Comoa iv Reoresentative

7,255 7,255 94 $827,000 8,500' Carl Huislander

Present Ooeration Rig Phone 435-220-0999 Tooinusher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-2240999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 17 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind U Yes No LCSO Samole Date Operator 3 84/04 RKB 15 ft

ma Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth 11

Sky: No Pass7 O Ye No Selvice 3 94/04 RKB CHF it

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jis. Run Settint Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35 35° Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 | 513 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H IDRAUL ICS REt ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size ManufacturerSerialNumber Jets DepthinFootageHis WOBRpm ROP ToothBearingGage

9 7 7/B Hughes HR-S35 5025771 14,14,15 6,964' 19T 19 40/35 120 10.4

10 7 7/6 Hughes HR-P66 5058382 15,15,15 7,161' 9T 7 1/2 35/40 91 12 9

Bli Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PL Wt SO WI ROi WI To ue
311.5 1 0 1 0 136

Pump
Slow Pump Pressu es

No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM

.. .
.025.........,

... .

.DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 100 297 1180 1/2

2 9x6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Lengh: 611 Description:

1- 6 1/4" jass(30.23), 6- 01/4" DC (178 18)
Mud motor 24*100 stk= 71 rpm,20 rot table = 91 rpmon bit

Smpl F.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Ennineer Mud Com any

PIT 9700 680 IO 118 91 #2 Desand Cent
1 9% KCL 145 145 16 John Limon M-I

#3 84 Desilt Mud CI Dally Cost Cumulative Cost

145 24 $2,414 $62,093
DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS

MD TVD VS CLOSURE

7150 7150

OPERAT ONS SU 1MARY
I .tL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0900 3.0 21 TOOH withbit. Function testedblind andpipe rams Time Si mmary
0900 1000 1.0 17 Service rig, change oil in motors Activity Daily Cum

1000 1330 3.5 28 WO bit #10 1. Mob/DeMob 75

1330 1630 3.0 21 TIH with bit 2. Cement 2.5

1630 1700 0.5 3 Fillpigeand break circuldong 3514' 3. Circulate 0 5 11

1700 1830 1.5 21 TIH 4. Directional Work

1830 1900 0.5 17 Service rig 5. DriNing 7 5 311.5

1900 2000 1.0 21 TlH to 7144 6. Drive Pige
2000 2130 1.5 25 Wash and team 7144' to 7161' 7. Fishing 53

2130 0130 4.0 5 Drilingfrom 7161' to7206, 11.25 ftihr 8. OH Loqqinq
0130 0230 1.0 20 Survey @715Œ - 5 deg 9. Lost Circ.
0230 0600 3.5 5 Drilingfmm 7206 to 7255 , 14 ft/hr 10 DrillCmt./LOT 3

11 N.U./N.D.
12 P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13 P.U./L.D. Pipe
14 RIU; RID 2.5

Morrison Shale: 0 Dakota 2230 15 Rig Repair 29.75

Morrison -2680' Curtis (Moab Tonque) - 3140 16 Run Casing 6 5

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 1T Service Rig 1 5 6 5

Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098 18 Sidetrack Op

Wngate - 4375' Chinie - 4960 19 StuckPipe 0 5

Shinarump - 5060 Moenkopi - 5100 20 Survey i 15 5

Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405 21 Trips 8 5 48 75

6
2

CG = 0 units 25 Wash & Ream 1 5 30

TG -0 units 26 Well Control
M FG = 0 units 27 WOC 12 5

28 Other 3 5 46.75

Total 24 673.25

Total dours 24 0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious 3ost $707,199

Daily Daily 1050 Gals Cement sx allyCo $31,660
Cum. 29.8 hrs Cum. 18140 Gals Barite: sx um. Co t

PPI MSC Exploration- nå Daily Drilling Report
Block. Lease and Wel No. Contract Rio Q.OJ. OfFE Date on Location Soud Date Renod Date

E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 31 30 7/27N4 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 27, 2004

MD M ERRiißt B AFE Amount Auth. TD. Comoa iv Reoresentative

7,255 7,255 94 $827,000 8,500' Carl Huislander

Present Ooeration Rig Phone 435-220-0999 Tooinusher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-2240999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 17 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind U Yes No LCSO Samole Date Operator 3 84/04 RKB 15 ft

ma Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth 11

Sky: No Pass7 O Ye No Selvice 3 94/04 RKB CHF it

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jis. Run Settint Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35 35° Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 | 513 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H IDRAUL ICS REt ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size ManufacturerSerialNumber Jets DepthinFootageHis WOBRpm ROP ToothBearingGage

9 7 7/B Hughes HR-S35 5025771 14,14,15 6,964' 19T 19 40/35 120 10.4

10 7 7/6 Hughes HR-P66 5058382 15,15,15 7,161' 9T 7 1/2 35/40 91 12 9

Bli Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PL Wt SO WI ROi WI To ue
311.5 1 0 1 0 136

Pump
Slow Pump Pressu es

No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM

.. .
.025.........,

... .

.DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 100 297 1180 1/2

2 9x6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Lengh: 611 Description:

1- 6 1/4" jass(30.23), 6- 01/4" DC (178 18)
Mud motor 24*100 stk= 71 rpm,20 rot table = 91 rpmon bit

Smpl F.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Ennineer Mud Com any

PIT 9700 680 IO 118 91 #2 Desand Cent
1 9% KCL 145 145 16 John Limon M-I

#3 84 Desilt Mud CI Dally Cost Cumulative Cost

145 24 $2,414 $62,093
DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS

MD TVD VS CLOSURE

7150 7150

OPERAT ONS SU 1MARY
I .tL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0900 3.0 21 TOOH withbit. Function testedblind andpipe rams Time Si mmary
0900 1000 1.0 17 Service rig, change oil in motors Activity Daily Cum

1000 1330 3.5 28 WO bit #10 1. Mob/DeMob 75

1330 1630 3.0 21 TIH with bit 2. Cement 2.5

1630 1700 0.5 3 Fillpigeand break circuldong 3514' 3. Circulate 0 5 11

1700 1830 1.5 21 TIH 4. Directional Work

1830 1900 0.5 17 Service rig 5. DriNing 7 5 311.5

1900 2000 1.0 21 TlH to 7144 6. Drive Pige
2000 2130 1.5 25 Wash and team 7144' to 7161' 7. Fishing 53

2130 0130 4.0 5 Drilingfrom 7161' to7206, 11.25 ftihr 8. OH Loqqinq
0130 0230 1.0 20 Survey @715Œ - 5 deg 9. Lost Circ.
0230 0600 3.5 5 Drilingfmm 7206 to 7255 , 14 ft/hr 10 DrillCmt./LOT 3

11 N.U./N.D.
12 P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13 P.U./L.D. Pipe
14 RIU; RID 2.5

Morrison Shale: 0 Dakota 2230 15 Rig Repair 29.75

Morrison -2680' Curtis (Moab Tonque) - 3140 16 Run Casing 6 5

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 1T Service Rig 1 5 6 5

Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098 18 Sidetrack Op

Wngate - 4375' Chinie - 4960 19 StuckPipe 0 5

Shinarump - 5060 Moenkopi - 5100 20 Survey i 15 5

Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405 21 Trips 8 5 48 75

6
2

CG = 0 units 25 Wash & Ream 1 5 30

TG -0 units 26 Well Control
M FG = 0 units 27 WOC 12 5

28 Other 3 5 46.75

Total 24 673.25

Total dours 24 0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious 3ost $707,199

Daily Daily 1050 Gals Cement sx allyCo $31,660
Cum. 29.8 hrs Cum. 18140 Gals Barite: sx um. Co t



PPI MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block. Lease and Well No. Contract Rio g g Date on Location Soud Date Renod Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 30 29 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 26, 2004

M M E201;gg g AFF Amoun1 Auth. TD. Comoanv Rearosentative
7,161 7,161 159 $827,000 6,500' Cari Hulslander

Present Queration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

TOH for new bH Rg Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES Peo e on Loc: 16 ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: Yes O No I C30 Samnin Date Operator 2 84/04 KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 O Yes Contractor 11 ext BOP Test Date ter Depth 11

Sky: O No Pass? O Yes ONo Service 3 94/04 RKB-CHF . !!

CASING RECORD
Casing Stdng OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8 4

BIT, WEIGHT, BPEED AND HYDRAULICS RECORD
BIT BR Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets De h In Foot e Hrs WOB R ROP Tooth Bearin Ga e

9 7 7/6 HuDhes HR-835 5025771 14,14,15 6,964 159' 19 30/35 116 8 4

Bit Remarks Cum ROT Hrs PU Wt so Wt ROTWI Torque
200 SA 140 136

Pump Slow P Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb . AV S ed SPM Pu #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

DC DP 1/4
1 0 x 6 3.15 120 378 1810 292 177 1/2
2 Oxo 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 611 Descdption:

1-61/4"jais(302316-61/4 DC(176to)
Mud motor .24* 120 stk= 86 rpm, 30 mi table = 116 rpm on bK

Ampi FL
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Com ny

PfË $0000 $40 SA 120 #1 02 esand Cent.
2% KCL 145 145 9 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 poslN Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost
145 24 $4,814) $¾9,619

DIRECTIONAL BU IVEYS
MOO

6 0
ANGLE Direction Coo nates VS DL CLOSURE

OPERALONS SU 1MARY
I AL Time Boats Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0830 2.5 5 Drilling7002' to 7020' Time Se mmary
0630 0900 0.5 20 Survey @ 6950 4.75 deg Aclivity Daily Cum
090D 0930 0.5 17 Selvice rig 1. MotWDeMob 75
0930 0200 16.5 5 Drillingto7161', Pressure increases 2. Cement 2.5
0200 0300 1.0 3 Circadateandconditlonhole 3. Cin:ulate i 10.5
0300 0600 3.0 21 TOOH 4. Directional Work

5. Drilling 19 304
6. Drive Pipe
7 Fishing 53
8. OH Loggng
9. I.ost Circ.
10 DrillCmt ILOT 3
11 N.U.I N.D.
12 P.U.IL.D BHA 13
13 P.U.lLD Plpe
14 R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230 15 Rig Repair 29.75
Morrison -2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140 16 Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17 Service Rig 0 5 5
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4090' 18 SidelmckOp.
Wngale - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19 Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shinarump - 506& Moonkopi - 5100' 20 Survey 0 5 14.5
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405 21 Trips 3 40 25

22 Tst. BOPs 5
No newshows 23 UR/HO
BG=2-17units 24 WOW
CG = 0 units 25 Wash &Ream 28.5
TG - 0 units 26 Well Contml
M FG = 0 units 27 WOC 12.5

28 Other 43.25
Total 24 649 25

Total iours 24 0
Rig Ocentime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $682,478

Dally Daily 1050 Gals Cement: ax Daly Cost $24,721
Cum. 29.8 hrs Cum. 17090 Gals Badle: sx Cum. Cost

PPI MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block. Lease and Well No. Contract Rio g g Date on Location Soud Date Renod Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 30 29 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 26, 2004

M M E201;gg g AFF Amoun1 Auth. TD. Comoanv Rearosentative
7,161 7,161 159 $827,000 6,500' Cari Hulslander

Present Queration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

TOH for new bH Rg Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES Peo e on Loc: 16 ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: Yes O No I C30 Samnin Date Operator 2 84/04 KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 O Yes Contractor 11 ext BOP Test Date ter Depth 11

Sky: O No Pass? O Yes ONo Service 3 94/04 RKB-CHF . !!

CASING RECORD
Casing Stdng OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8 4

BIT, WEIGHT, BPEED AND HYDRAULICS RECORD
BIT BR Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets De h In Foot e Hrs WOB R ROP Tooth Bearin Ga e

9 7 7/6 HuDhes HR-835 5025771 14,14,15 6,964 159' 19 30/35 116 8 4

Bit Remarks Cum ROT Hrs PU Wt so Wt ROTWI Torque
200 SA 140 136

Pump Slow P Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb . AV S ed SPM Pu #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

DC DP 1/4
1 0 x 6 3.15 120 378 1810 292 177 1/2
2 Oxo 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 611 Descdption:

1-61/4"jais(302316-61/4 DC(176to)
Mud motor .24* 120 stk= 86 rpm, 30 mi table = 116 rpm on bK

Ampi FL
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Com ny

PfË $0000 $40 SA 120 #1 02 esand Cent.
2% KCL 145 145 9 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 poslN Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost
145 24 $4,814) $¾9,619

DIRECTIONAL BU IVEYS
MOO

6 0
ANGLE Direction Coo nates VS DL CLOSURE

OPERALONS SU 1MARY
I AL Time Boats Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0830 2.5 5 Drilling7002' to 7020' Time Se mmary
0630 0900 0.5 20 Survey @ 6950 4.75 deg Aclivity Daily Cum
090D 0930 0.5 17 Selvice rig 1. MotWDeMob 75
0930 0200 16.5 5 Drillingto7161', Pressure increases 2. Cement 2.5
0200 0300 1.0 3 Circadateandconditlonhole 3. Cin:ulate i 10.5
0300 0600 3.0 21 TOOH 4. Directional Work

5. Drilling 19 304
6. Drive Pipe
7 Fishing 53
8. OH Loggng
9. I.ost Circ.
10 DrillCmt ILOT 3
11 N.U.I N.D.
12 P.U.IL.D BHA 13
13 P.U.lLD Plpe
14 R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230 15 Rig Repair 29.75
Morrison -2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140 16 Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17 Service Rig 0 5 5
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4090' 18 SidelmckOp.
Wngale - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19 Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shinarump - 506& Moonkopi - 5100' 20 Survey 0 5 14.5
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405 21 Trips 3 40 25

22 Tst. BOPs 5
No newshows 23 UR/HO
BG=2-17units 24 WOW
CG = 0 units 25 Wash &Ream 28.5
TG - 0 units 26 Well Contml
M FG = 0 units 27 WOC 12.5

28 Other 43.25
Total 24 649 25

Total iours 24 0
Rig Ocentime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $682,478

Dally Daily 1050 Gals Cement: ax Daly Cost $24,721
Cum. 29.8 hrs Cum. 17090 Gals Badle: sx Cum. Cost



PPÍ MSC Exploration
n o* Daily Drilling Report

Block. Lease and WellNo, Contract Ria 99.6 QEg Date on Location Soud Date Recort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 33 32 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 29, 2004

_M.Q M Footage AF No. AFß Amognt Auth.TD. Compa ly Representative

7,788 7,788 401 $827,000 8,500' Roger Knight

Present Qggration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 19 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes U No 1.050 Sample Date Operator 5 . 8/6/04 KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date ater Depth ft

Sky: O No Pass7 Yes No Service 3 9/6/04 KB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIÝ,WEIGHÝ,SUËEDÅNDH<bnAutics akt oito
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets De th In Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

11 7 7/8" Reed HP 64 k83184 14,14,14 7353' 435' 27 1/2 35 101 15.8

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROl Wt Tor ue
348 162 1- 0 140

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

1 9 x 6 3.15 100 297 1260 211 359 151 250 1/2 61 500

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 611' Description:

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')

Mud motor .24* 100 stk= 71 rpm, 30 tot table = 101 rpm on bit

MUD DATA
WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT 8.9 55 20 23 12/19 9.8 2 4 0.25 10.5 10. 0.3 1.6/2.85

Smpi l-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

W 9500 120 98 120 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
1.8% KCL 145 145 24 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Deslit Mud Ci Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 24 $3,4AO $69, 96

VS

OPERAT ONS SullMARY
úlL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 1530 9.5 5 Drill7387' to 7511' Time St mmary

1530 1600 0.5 17 Service rig Activity Daily Cum.

1600 0600 14.0 5 Drill7511' to 7788' 1. Mob/DeMob 75
2. Cement 2.5
3. Circulate 12
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 23.5 346

6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 53
8. OHLogging

Inspected 5 1/2" 17# casing. 8230' of casing on location 9. Lost Circ.
10. Drill Cmt./LOT 3
11. N.U.I N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13

13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale -0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 31.75

Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 0.5 7

Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5

Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 15.5

Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' ? 21. Trips 58.25
22. Tst. BOPs 5

7427' fracture before-12 u; during 24 u; after - 18 u 23. UR/HO

BG = 8 - 88 units 24. W.O.W.

CG = 5 units RECHVH > 25. Wash & Ream 30.5

TG - 0 units 26. Well Control

Total 24 721.25

Total dours 24.0 OlvAFDIfPU SMlÑ\Ñ
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage BulkMaterial on Board revious Cost $772,950

Daily Daily 1030 Gals Cement: sx ailyCost $23,795

Cum. 29.8 hrs Cum. 19830 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost

PPÍ MSC Exploration
n o* Daily Drilling Report

Block. Lease and WellNo, Contract Ria 99.6 QEg Date on Location Soud Date Recort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 33 32 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 29, 2004

_M.Q M Footage AF No. AFß Amognt Auth.TD. Compa ly Representative

7,788 7,788 401 $827,000 8,500' Roger Knight

Present Qggration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 19 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes U No 1.050 Sample Date Operator 5 . 8/6/04 KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date ater Depth ft

Sky: O No Pass7 Yes No Service 3 9/6/04 KB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIÝ,WEIGHÝ,SUËEDÅNDH<bnAutics akt oito
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets De th In Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

11 7 7/8" Reed HP 64 k83184 14,14,14 7353' 435' 27 1/2 35 101 15.8

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROl Wt Tor ue
348 162 1- 0 140

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

1 9 x 6 3.15 100 297 1260 211 359 151 250 1/2 61 500

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 611' Description:

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')

Mud motor .24* 100 stk= 71 rpm, 30 tot table = 101 rpm on bit

MUD DATA
WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT 8.9 55 20 23 12/19 9.8 2 4 0.25 10.5 10. 0.3 1.6/2.85

Smpi l-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

W 9500 120 98 120 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
1.8% KCL 145 145 24 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Deslit Mud Ci Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 24 $3,4AO $69, 96

VS

OPERAT ONS SullMARY
úlL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 1530 9.5 5 Drill7387' to 7511' Time St mmary

1530 1600 0.5 17 Service rig Activity Daily Cum.

1600 0600 14.0 5 Drill7511' to 7788' 1. Mob/DeMob 75

2. Cement 2.5

3. Circulate 12

4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 23.5 346

6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 53
8. OHLogging

Inspected 5 1/2" 17# casing. 8230' of casing on location 9. Lost Circ.
10. Drill Cmt./LOT 3
11. N.U.I N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13

13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale -0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 31.75

Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 0.5 7

Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5

Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 15.5

Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' ? 21. Trips 58.25
22. Tst. BOPs 5

7427' fracture before-12 u; during 24 u; after - 18 u 23. UR/HO

BG = 8 - 88 units 24. W.O.W.

CG = 5 units RECHVH > 25. Wash & Ream 30.5

TG - 0 units 26. Well Control

Total 24 721.25

Total dours 24.0 OlvAFDIfPU SMlÑ\Ñ
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage BulkMaterial on Board revious Cost $772,950

Daily Daily 1030 Gals Cement: sx ailyCost $23,795

Cum. 29.8 hrs Cum. 19830 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block Leaqq and Wêll N9. Contract Rig & Q Date on Location Soud Date Report Dgte
E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 32 31 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 28, 2004

Footaqq AFE No. AFEAmount Auth.TD. Company Representative
7,387 7,387 132 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present ODeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 16 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes No LC50 Sample Date Operator 2 8/6/04 KB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date ater Depth ft
Sky: No Pass7 O Yes No Service 3 9/6/04 KB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H TDRAULICS RE( ORD
BIT

. Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Site Manufacturer Serial Number Jets De th in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
10 7 7/8 Hughes HR-P66 5058382 15,15,15 7,161' 198' 14 1/2 35/40 91 13.7 3 3 1/8
11 7 7/8" Reed HP 64 k83184 14,14,14 7353' 34' 4 40 91 8,5
BitRemarks: Cum. ROT.Hrs PU Wt SO,Wt RO I Wt Torque

322.b 1bu 140 136
Pump Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 | Pump #3
gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 100 297 1260 211 359 151 250 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 611' Description:

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')
Mud motor .24* 100 stk= 71 rpm, 20 rot table = 91 rpm on bit

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT 9 38 11 10 9/21 9.4 2 5 0.33 12.5 8.7 0.25 .05/1.2

Smpi E.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud CompanyPÜ 10000 a20 84 #1 #2 Desand Cent.

2% KCL 145 145 11 John Limon M-I
#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI DailyCost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 11 54,262 | $66,355

MD TVD ANGLE CLOSURE
7288' 7288' 4.00 °

OPERAT ONS SUllMARY
IAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1300 7.0 5 Dritt7255' to 7353' Time St mmary1300 1400 1.0 3 Circulate, mix & pump pill, drop survey Activity Daily Cum.
1400 1900 5.0 21 TOOH 1. Mob/DeMob 751900 2100 2.0 15 Repair hydromatic 2. Cement 2.52100 0130 4.5 21 TlH to 7297'. Load drill pipe @3544' 3. Circulate 1 12
0130 0200 0.5 25 Wash and ream 7297' to 7353' 4. Directional Work
0200 0600 4.0 5 Drill7353' to 7387' 5. Drilling 11 322.5

Survey 7288' - 4 deg 6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Lopping
9. LostCirc.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. RIU; RID 2.5

MorrisonShale - O' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 6.5
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shina rump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 15.5
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim-7296' ? 21. Trips 9.5 58.25

22. Tst. BOPs 5
No new shows 23. UR/HO
BG = 2 - 15 units 24. W.O.W.
CG = 0 units 25. Wash & Ream 0.5 30.5
TG - 94 units 26. WellControl
M FG = 0 units 27. WOC 12.5

28. Other 46.75

Total lours 24.0 Total 24 697.25
Rig Do vntime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $738,859Daily Daily 660 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $31,841Cum. 29.8 hrs Cum. 18800 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

PPI MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block Leaqq and Wêll N9. Contract Rig & Q Date on Location Soud Date Report Dgte
E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 32 31 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 28, 2004

Footaqq AFE No. AFEAmount Auth.TD. Company Representative
7,387 7,387 132 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present ODeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 16 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes No LC50 Sample Date Operator 2 8/6/04 KB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date ater Depth ft
Sky: No Pass7 O Yes No Service 3 9/6/04 KB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H TDRAULICS RE( ORD
BIT

. Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Site Manufacturer Serial Number Jets De th in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
10 7 7/8 Hughes HR-P66 5058382 15,15,15 7,161' 198' 14 1/2 35/40 91 13.7 3 3 1/8
11 7 7/8" Reed HP 64 k83184 14,14,14 7353' 34' 4 40 91 8,5
BitRemarks: Cum. ROT.Hrs PU Wt SO,Wt RO I Wt Torque

322.b 1bu 140 136
Pump Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 | Pump #3
gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 100 297 1260 211 359 151 250 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 611' Description:

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')
Mud motor .24* 100 stk= 71 rpm, 20 rot table = 91 rpm on bit

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT 9 38 11 10 9/21 9.4 2 5 0.33 12.5 8.7 0.25 .05/1.2

Smpi E.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud CompanyPÜ 10000 a20 84 #1 #2 Desand Cent.

2% KCL 145 145 11 John Limon M-I
#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI DailyCost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 11 54,262 | $66,355

MD TVD ANGLE CLOSURE
7288' 7288' 4.00 °

OPERAT ONS SUllMARY
IAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1300 7.0 5 Dritt7255' to 7353' Time St mmary1300 1400 1.0 3 Circulate, mix & pump pill, drop survey Activity Daily Cum.
1400 1900 5.0 21 TOOH 1. Mob/DeMob 751900 2100 2.0 15 Repair hydromatic 2. Cement 2.52100 0130 4.5 21 TlH to 7297'. Load drill pipe @3544' 3. Circulate 1 12
0130 0200 0.5 25 Wash and ream 7297' to 7353' 4. Directional Work
0200 0600 4.0 5 Drill7353' to 7387' 5. Drilling 11 322.5

Survey 7288' - 4 deg 6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Lopping
9. LostCirc.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. RIU; RID 2.5

MorrisonShale - O' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 6.5
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shina rump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 15.5
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim-7296' ? 21. Trips 9.5 58.25

22. Tst. BOPs 5
No new shows 23. UR/HO
BG = 2 - 15 units 24. W.O.W.
CG = 0 units 25. Wash & Ream 0.5 30.5
TG - 94 units 26. WellControl
M FG = 0 units 27. WOC 12.5

28. Other 46.75

Total lours 24.0 Total 24 697.25
Rig Do vntime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $738,859Daily Daily 660 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $31,841Cum. 29.8 hrs Cum. 18800 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSÒË loration
"°i°¤ Daily Drilling Report

Block. Lese and Well No contractkia a O balaenLocation Snid Date kepot b.ie
E Created .luction Widcat - Slate MSC 3 1 Union if/ 37 36 7¢27/2004 .Añ28, 200# Sep 2 2000

M_D M Engang AFE Amount Aulla To comnanyReorementenve

8 700 8,70D 171 $827,000 8,500 CarlHuldender

Present Ooeration Rig Phone 43&22O4999 ociougher

TOOH for new driidling Rig Fax: 43>22D 0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Whaiher DONR Vist NADES People on Loc 18 GskBOP Test Date RIG ELEVAT10NS

Wind: L_)Yes U No CSD rgpjgggtg Operalor 4 8Æl2004 RKB 15 11

Seas: Problem? Yes Contrador 11 Next BOP Test Data Waer Depth i

Sky: No Pass? Yes UNo Service 3 95/2004 RK&CHF I

CASING RECORD
Cadng String OD W Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD 7VD Run Pres EMW Lemko

Conductor 12 3f4 24 LP Wald 2 35 3& Air

Surface 85/8" . 24 K55 STC 13 513 513 84

BIÝ, GH Ÿ,SPEED ANb H thitAuLicano enn
B1T 81!Typeand Tda Am Grade

No Size Manufaclurer Serial Number Jets th n F Hrs WOB ROP Toulh

12 717/8" Reed HP 83 E25193 14,14,15 8,188 514 44 1/2 30f35 101 11.6

BR Remarks Cum ROT Hrs À SO WI kot N Ier un

419 1/B 150 152

Pump
Slow Pleasares

No Sirdre X Uner Oulput SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM ump

gps DC DP 1

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 9x6 3.15 3M

BHA
Lenglh: 61¾ Desaiption: bi, 1• mud maior (28 04 ), 1-188 (3 G7p 1- 8 1M" DC (30 85), i iBS (3 90 ), 11 - DC 6 1/4" (337 06)

1-61/4"jars(3023),6-61/4"DC(17618)

Mud motor 24* 100 sik= 71 spm. 30 tot table a 101 rpm on bit

Smpl El.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud y

Pil 14UUU 2DU i 121 81 42 Desand Cent.

2.2% KCL 145 145 12 John Umon M i

#3 #4 DesiR Mud CI Daly Cost ÒumuldimCost

bikkellukALW ivkys
is 24 sa.isa j sau.;4a

MD TVD ANGLE Direcilon Cocidinales VS DL CLð$URE

okkkAl uWasu MAY
(L T1me Boals: Supply Bod Name: Stdus:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Stdus:

0600 1500 9 O 5 Jrill to 8629 Time Semmary

1500 1530 0 5 17 Service Rig Daily Cum

1530 2330 8 0 5 Dril to 8700 i MoblDeMob 75

2330 0030 1 0 3 3rtula1e botloms up Mixand pump pill 2 Cement 2.5

0030 OODO 5 5 21 Rig up lay down machine TOOH. WII laydown 2000 4.5' &4 DCs 3 Orculate 1 13.5
4 DhmetionalWork
5 Driling 17 419

3 OrNe Pipe
7 Fishing 53

8 OH Logging
9 Lost Cire.

10 DrillCmt/LOT 3
11 N.UJN.D.
12 P.U.JLD BHA 13

13 P.U.)LD Pipe
14 RAJ;RID 25

Monison Shale - 0 Dakota 2230' 15 Rig Repair 33 25

Monison - 2680 Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140 16 Run Casing 6 5

Entrada - Š263 Carmei - 3684' 17 Service Rig 0.5 9 5

Nawojo- 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18 Sideirack Op.

Wingate - 4375 Chinie - 4960' 19 Stuck Pipe 0 5

Shinarump - 5060 Mownkopi- 5100 20 Strvey 16 5

Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296 21 Trips 5.5 74 75
22 Tst. BOPs 5

Show 8516 - 8625 before 7 u; dudng 22 u; after 12 u 23 UR/HO
BG=6-18units 24 WOW

CG = 21 units 25 Wash &Ream 30 5

TG - O units ,
26 Weli con1rt!

MFG=0un. CCEIW-L ""°° '26

CNorides increased g 8680 to 14000 28 Other 46 75

Total leurs 24.0
otal 24 817 25

Rig Dr wdime Fuel Usage lhdk Material an Board Cost $873768

Daly Daily 700 Gals Cement: sx aÌIy Cost 521)$82

Cum 31.3hrs Cum. 22861 Gais Batite: fy Cost Š895,050
' M

PPI MSÒË loration
"°i°¤ Daily Drilling Report

Block. Lese and Well No contractkia a O balaenLocation Snid Date kepot b.ie
E Created .luction Widcat - Slate MSC 3 1 Union if/ 37 36 7¢27/2004 .Añ28, 200# Sep 2 2000

M_D M Engang AFE Amount Aulla To comnanyReorementenve

8 700 8,70D 171 $827,000 8,500 CarlHuldender

Present Ooeration Rig Phone 43&22O4999 ociougher

TOOH for new driidling Rig Fax: 43>22D 0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Whaiher DONR Vist NADES People on Loc 18 GskBOP Test Date RIG ELEVAT10NS

Wind: L_)Yes U No CSD rgpjgggtg Operalor 4 8Æl2004 RKB 15 11

Seas: Problem? Yes Contrador 11 Next BOP Test Data Waer Depth i

Sky: No Pass? Yes UNo Service 3 95/2004 RK&CHF I

CASING RECORD
Cadng String OD W Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD 7VD Run Pres EMW Lemko

Conductor 12 3f4 24 LP Wald 2 35 3& Air

Surface 85/8" . 24 K55 STC 13 513 513 84

BIÝ, GH Ÿ,SPEED ANb H thitAuLicano enn
B1T 81!Typeand Tda Am Grade

No Size Manufaclurer Serial Number Jets th n F Hrs WOB ROP Toulh

12 717/8" Reed HP 83 E25193 14,14,15 8,188 514 44 1/2 30f35 101 11.6

BR Remarks Cum ROT Hrs À SO WI kot N Ier un

419 1/B 150 152

Pump
Slow Pleasares

No Sirdre X Uner Oulput SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM ump

gps DC DP 1

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 9x6 3.15 3M

BHA
Lenglh: 61¾ Desaiption: bi, 1• mud maior (28 04 ), 1-188 (3 G7p 1- 8 1M" DC (30 85), i iBS (3 90 ), 11 - DC 6 1/4" (337 06)

1-61/4"jars(3023),6-61/4"DC(17618)

Mud motor 24* 100 sik= 71 spm. 30 tot table a 101 rpm on bit

Smpl El.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud y

Pil 14UUU 2DU i 121 81 42 Desand Cent.

2.2% KCL 145 145 12 John Umon M i

#3 #4 DesiR Mud CI Daly Cost ÒumuldimCost

bikkellukALW ivkys
is 24 sa.isa j sau.;4a

MD TVD ANGLE Direcilon Cocidinales VS DL CLð$URE

okkkAl uWasu MAY
(L T1me Boals: Supply Bod Name: Stdus:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Stdus:

0600 1500 9 O 5 Jrill to 8629 Time Semmary

1500 1530 0 5 17 Service Rig Daily Cum

1530 2330 8 0 5 Dril to 8700 i MoblDeMob 75

2330 0030 1 0 3 3rtula1e botloms up Mixand pump pill 2 Cement 2.5

0030 OODO 5 5 21 Rig up lay down machine TOOH. WII laydown 2000 4.5' &4 DCs 3 Orculate 1 13.5
4 DhmetionalWork
5 Driling 17 419

3 OrNe Pipe
7 Fishing 53

8 OH Logging
9 Lost Cire.

10 DrillCmt/LOT 3
11 N.UJN.D.
12 P.U.JLD BHA 13

13 P.U.)LD Pipe
14 RAJ;RID 25

Monison Shale - 0 Dakota 2230' 15 Rig Repair 33 25

Monison - 2680 Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140 16 Run Casing 6 5

Entrada - Š263 Carmei - 3684' 17 Service Rig 0.5 9 5

Nawojo- 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18 Sideirack Op.

Wingate - 4375 Chinie - 4960' 19 Stuck Pipe 0 5

Shinarump - 5060 Mownkopi- 5100 20 Strvey 16 5

Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296 21 Trips 5.5 74 75
22 Tst. BOPs 5

Show 8516 - 8625 before 7 u; dudng 22 u; after 12 u 23 UR/HO
BG=6-18units 24 WOW

CG = 21 units 25 Wash &Ream 30 5

TG - O units ,
26 Weli con1rt!

MFG=0un. CCEIW-L ""°° '26

CNorides increased g 8680 to 14000 28 Other 46 75

Total leurs 24.0
otal 24 817 25

Rig Dr wdime Fuel Usage lhdk Material an Board Cost $873768

Daly Daily 700 Gals Cement: sx aÌIy Cost 521)$82

Cum 31.3hrs Cum. 22861 Gais Batite: fy Cost Š895,050
' M



PPI MSC Exploration
n og Daily Drilling Report

Block. Lease and Well No. Contract Ria SQL OFJ Dale on location Soud Date ReportDate
E. Crested Juction Wildcal - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 34 33 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 30, 2004

MR Iyg FR91ggg & AFE Amount B Comoa Iv Reoresentative
8,115 8,115 327 $827,000 8,500' RogerKnight

Present Ooeration RiO Phone: 435-220-0999 ToolDMSher

Driling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR VisK NPDES People on Loc : 19 ast BOP Test Date - RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50 Samole Date Operator 5 8Æl04 RKB 15 11
Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? _AYes UNo Service 3 95/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD WL Grade Conn. Uts Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35 35 Air

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEEDAND HYDRAULIC3 RECORD
BIT Bli Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets De n Foot Hrs WOB R ROP Tooln Be G e
11 7 7/8" Reed HP 64 ko3184 14,14,14 7353 762' 49 1/2 35 101 15 4

Rif Ramarks Cum ROT Hm PU Wt SO WI ROTWt To ue
368 182 142 150

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM . GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S ed SPM Pum #1 Pu $2 Pum #3

DC DP 114
1 9x6 3.15 101 297 1200 211 355 151 250 1/2 60 500
2 9x6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Lengh: 011 Description:

1- 6 1/4' jars(3023'), 6- 61/4* DC (176 18)
Mud motor 24*100 stk= 71 rpm,30 rol table = 101 rpmon bit

smpi W.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Ennineer Mud Com ny

PIT 10000 400 97 120 #1 #2 Cent
2% KCL 145 145 18 John Limon El

#3 #4 DesiK Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost
145 24 $2,628 S/2,423

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYB
MD VS CLOSURE

3PERAT 3NB SUt.MARY
I AL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name Status:

FROM To HouR code cow Boat Name: Status:
0600 1200 6.0 5 Drillfrom 7788' to 7862 Time Srmmary
1200 1230 0 5 17 Service rig Activity Daily Cum.
1230 1830 6 0 5 Drillfrom 7882' to7976 1 Mob/DeMob 75
1830 2000 1 5 15 Repair Jackshalt chain 2 Coment 2.5
2000 0600 10 0 5 Drillfrom 7976 to8115 3 Circulate 12

4 Directional Work
5 Drilling 22 368
6 Drive Pipe
7 Fishing 53
8 OH Loqqinq
9 Lost Circ.
10 DrillCmt.lLOT 3
11 N.U./ N.D.
12 P.U.lL.D. BHA 13
13 P.U./L.D. Pipe
14 RIU; RID 2.5

Monison Shale - 0 Dakota 2230' 15 Rig Repair 1.5 33.25
Monison - 268& Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140 16 Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263 Carmel - 3684' 17 ServiceRig 0.5 7.5
Navolo - 3843' Kayenta - 4090' 18 Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19 StuckPipe 0.5
Shinarump - 5060 Mownkopi- 5100 20 Survey 15.5
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405 White Rim - 7296 ? 21 Trips 58.25

22 Tst. BOPs 5
No newshows 23 UR/HO
BG=65-85units 24 WO.W
CG = 0 units 25 Wash &Ream 30.5
TG -0 units 26 Well Control
M FG = Ounits 27 WOC 12.5

28 Other 46.75
Tolal 24 745.25

Total dours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage BulkMalerial on Board reviousCost $796,745

Daily 1.5 hrs Daily 756 Gals Cement: sx ily Cost $24,845
Cum. 31.3 hrs Cum. 20586 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost

PPI MSC Exploration
n og Daily Drilling Report

Block. Lease and Well No. Contract Ria SQL OFJ Dale on location Soud Date ReportDate
E. Crested Juction Wildcal - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 34 33 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Aug 30, 2004

MR Iyg FR91ggg & AFE Amount B Comoa Iv Reoresentative
8,115 8,115 327 $827,000 8,500' RogerKnight

Present Ooeration RiO Phone: 435-220-0999 ToolDMSher

Driling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR VisK NPDES People on Loc : 19 ast BOP Test Date - RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50 Samole Date Operator 5 8Æl04 RKB 15 11
Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? _AYes UNo Service 3 95/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD WL Grade Conn. Uts Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35 35 Air

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEEDAND HYDRAULIC3 RECORD
BIT Bli Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets De n Foot Hrs WOB R ROP Tooln Be G e
11 7 7/8" Reed HP 64 ko3184 14,14,14 7353 762' 49 1/2 35 101 15 4

Rif Ramarks Cum ROT Hm PU Wt SO WI ROTWt To ue
368 182 142 150

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM . GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S ed SPM Pum #1 Pu $2 Pum #3

DC DP 114
1 9x6 3.15 101 297 1200 211 355 151 250 1/2 60 500
2 9x6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Lengh: 011 Description:

1- 6 1/4' jars(3023'), 6- 61/4* DC (176 18)
Mud motor 24*100 stk= 71 rpm,30 rol table = 101 rpmon bit

smpi W.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Ennineer Mud Com ny

PIT 10000 400 97 120 #1 #2 Cent
2% KCL 145 145 18 John Limon El

#3 #4 DesiK Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost
145 24 $2,628 S/2,423

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYB
MD VS CLOSURE

3PERAT 3NB SUt.MARY
I AL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name Status:

FROM To HouR code cow Boat Name: Status:
0600 1200 6.0 5 Drillfrom 7788' to 7862 Time Srmmary
1200 1230 0 5 17 Service rig Activity Daily Cum.
1230 1830 6 0 5 Drillfrom 7882' to7976 1 Mob/DeMob 75
1830 2000 1 5 15 Repair Jackshalt chain 2 Coment 2.5
2000 0600 10 0 5 Drillfrom 7976 to8115 3 Circulate 12

4 Directional Work
5 Drilling 22 368
6 Drive Pipe
7 Fishing 53
8 OH Loqqinq
9 Lost Circ.
10 DrillCmt.lLOT 3
11 N.U./ N.D.
12 P.U.lL.D. BHA 13
13 P.U./L.D. Pipe
14 RIU; RID 2.5

Monison Shale - 0 Dakota 2230' 15 Rig Repair 1.5 33.25
Monison - 268& Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140 16 Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263 Carmel - 3684' 17 ServiceRig 0.5 7.5
Navolo - 3843' Kayenta - 4090' 18 Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19 StuckPipe 0.5
Shinarump - 5060 Mownkopi- 5100 20 Survey 15.5
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405 White Rim - 7296 ? 21 Trips 58.25

22 Tst. BOPs 5
No newshows 23 UR/HO
BG=65-85units 24 WO.W
CG = 0 units 25 Wash &Ream 30.5
TG -0 units 26 Well Control
M FG = Ounits 27 WOC 12.5

28 Other 46.75
Tolal 24 745.25

Total dours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage BulkMalerial on Board reviousCost $796,745

Daily 1.5 hrs Daily 756 Gals Cement: sx ily Cost $24,845
Cum. 31.3 hrs Cum. 20586 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost



Pfl MSC Explorationne Daily Drilling Report
B19ck.Leaseand Well No. Contract RIa RO QEg Date on Location Spud Date Report Dpte

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 38 37 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 3, 2004
Mg ly_D_ Footage AFE No. AFRAmount Auth. TD. Company Representative

8,725 8,725 25 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander
Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 15 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: Ù Yes No LC50Sample Date Operator 1 8/6/2004 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 NextBOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: No Pass? O Yes No Service 3 9/6/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 KSS STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HiDRAULICS REGORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
12 7/7/8" Reed HP 63 E25193 14,14,15 8,186' 514' 44 1/2 30/35 101 11.6 3 3 I
13 7/7/8" Reed HP 65 MH4210 14,15,15 8,700' 25' 2 30 100 12.5
Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

419
Pump Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3
gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 100 297 1690 151 250 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 489' Description: bit, 1- mud motor (28.64'), 1-IBS (3.07)- 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.85'), 1 IBS (3.90'), 7 - DC 6 1/4" (337.05')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')
Mud motor .24* 100 stk= 71 rpm, 29 rot table = 100 rpm on bit

Smpi F.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours MudEngineer Mud Company

Pfl 10200 A00 93 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2% KCL 145 145 24 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SU IVEYS
145 24 $2,123 $82,871

MD TVD ANGLE Direction Coordinates VS DL CLOSURE

OPERATIONS SUMMARY
IAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0900 3.0 21 Finish TOOH and LD 4 DC's and 2300' DP Time St mmary
0900 1100 2.0 21 PU Bit #13 & GlH with BHA. Activity Daily Cum.
1100 1400 3.0 15 Change out Drillline. 1. MoblDeMob 75
1400 1430 0.5 17 Service Rig 2. Cement 2.5
1430 2200 7.5 21 Strap and pick70 jtsof 3-1/2", S135 DP (2221.18') 3. Circulate 13.5
2200 0230 4.5 21 TIH 4. Directional Work
0230 0400 1.5 21 PU 4 jts. Of 4-1/2" DP &wash to bottom. No fill. 5. Drilling 2 421
0400 0600 2.0 5 Drillingto 8725'. 6. Drive Pipe

7. Fishing 53
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 11. N.U./ N.D.
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta -4098' 13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 14. R/U; RID 2.5
Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 15. Rip Repair 3 36.25
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' 16. Run Casing 6.5

17. Service Rig 0.5 10
18. Sidetrack Op.

BG = 8-12 units 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
CG = 21 units 20. Survey 16.5
TG - 192 units 21. Trips 18.5 93.25
M FG = 0 units 22. Tst. BOPs 5

23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.

RECEIVF ) 25.Wash&Ream 30.5
26. Well Control

Total 24 841.25
Total Mours 24.0

. C iL,CRig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious Cost $895,650
Daily Daily 812 Gals Cement: sx ailyCost $21,889
Cum. 31.3 hrs Cum. 23673 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost

Pfl MSC Explorationne Daily Drilling Report
B19ck.Leaseand Well No. Contract RIa RO QEg Date on Location Spud Date Report Dpte

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 38 37 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 3, 2004
Mg ly_D_ Footage AFE No. AFRAmount Auth. TD. Company Representative

8,725 8,725 25 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander
Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 15 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: Ù Yes No LC50Sample Date Operator 1 8/6/2004 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 NextBOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: No Pass? O Yes No Service 3 9/6/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 KSS STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HiDRAULICS REGORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
12 7/7/8" Reed HP 63 E25193 14,14,15 8,186' 514' 44 1/2 30/35 101 11.6 3 3 I
13 7/7/8" Reed HP 65 MH4210 14,15,15 8,700' 25' 2 30 100 12.5
Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

419
Pump Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3
gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 100 297 1690 151 250 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 489' Description: bit, 1- mud motor (28.64'), 1-IBS (3.07)- 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.85'), 1 IBS (3.90'), 7 - DC 6 1/4" (337.05')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')
Mud motor .24* 100 stk= 71 rpm, 29 rot table = 100 rpm on bit

Smpi F.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours MudEngineer Mud Company

Pfl 10200 A00 93 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2% KCL 145 145 24 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SU IVEYS
145 24 $2,123 $82,871

MD TVD ANGLE Direction Coordinates VS DL CLOSURE

OPERATIONS SUMMARY
IAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0900 3.0 21 Finish TOOH and LD 4 DC's and 2300' DP Time St mmary
0900 1100 2.0 21 PU Bit #13 & GlH with BHA. Activity Daily Cum.
1100 1400 3.0 15 Change out Drillline. 1. MoblDeMob 75
1400 1430 0.5 17 Service Rig 2. Cement 2.5
1430 2200 7.5 21 Strap and pick70 jtsof 3-1/2", S135 DP (2221.18') 3. Circulate 13.5
2200 0230 4.5 21 TIH 4. Directional Work
0230 0400 1.5 21 PU 4 jts. Of 4-1/2" DP &wash to bottom. No fill. 5. Drilling 2 421
0400 0600 2.0 5 Drillingto 8725'. 6. Drive Pipe

7. Fishing 53
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 11. N.U./ N.D.
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta -4098' 13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 14. R/U; RID 2.5
Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 15. Rip Repair 3 36.25
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' 16. Run Casing 6.5

17. Service Rig 0.5 10
18. Sidetrack Op.

BG = 8-12 units 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
CG = 21 units 20. Survey 16.5
TG - 192 units 21. Trips 18.5 93.25
M FG = 0 units 22. Tst. BOPs 5

23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.

RECEIVF ) 25.Wash&Ream 30.5
26. Well Control

Total 24 841.25
Total Mours 24.0

. C iL,CRig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious Cost $895,650
Daily Daily 812 Gals Cement: sx ailyCost $21,889
Cum. 31.3 hrs Cum. 23673 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost



MPPI MSC Exploration
ne ' Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease andWellNo. CentractRio Ë$ Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date
E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 40 39 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 5, 2004

MD TVD Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative

9,182 9,182 232 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operption Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: Yes No g,gglyp[g ag Operator 1 8/6/04 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth it

Sky: No Pass? O Yes O No Service 2 9/6/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Settint Depth LinerTop MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT, SPEED AÑDHIDRAULICSRË(ORD
BIT Blt Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

13 7/7/8" Smith S65 MH4210 14,15,15 8,700' 482' 46 30 105 10.5

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

466 166 1:8 Ab0
Pump

Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Uner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump © mg #3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9x6 3.15 98 291 2150 192 130 249 1/2 60 630

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 489' Description:

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'),6- 61/4" DC (176.18') - 2218'of 3.5'" S135 DP

Mudmotor .24*98 stk= 70 rpm, 35 rot table= 105 rpm on bit
MUDbATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT 8.9 49 21 22 10/22 6.2 2 4 0.33 12.6 10 0.3 .2/1.5

Šmpi E.L

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours MudEngineer Mud Company

10000 200 00 122 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2 % KCL 145 451 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Deslit Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

145 24 $4,010 $90,297

DIRECŸIOÑALsbRVEYS

OPERAT ONS SUilMARY
TIME Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0800 2.0 5 Drillto 8976' Time St mmary

0800 0830 0.5 17 Service rig Activity Daily Cum.

0830 1430 6.0 5 Drillto 9036' 1. Mob/DeMob 75

1430 1630 2.0 15 Circulate pull 2 stands, change out kelly swivel, TlH 2. Cement 2.5

1630 0600 13.5 5 Drillto 9182' 3. Circulate 13.5

4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 21.5 465

6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. Drill Cmt.lLOT 3
11. N.U.I N.D.
12. P.tJ./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale -0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 2 38.25

Morrison - 2680' Curtis (MoabTongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 0.5 11

Navojo - 3843' Kayenta -4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5

Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 17.5

Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' 21. Trips 93.25
22. Tst. BOPs 5

no new shows 23. UR/HO

BG = 4-12 units RECO VE 24. W.O.W.

CG = 14 units 25. Wash & Ream 30.5

TG - 0 units 26. WellControl

MFG = 0 units 27. WOC 12.5

o lhi 28. Other 46.75

Da UPOiL,or " Total 24 889.25

Total dours 24.0
Rig Dcuntime Fuel Usage ulk Material on Board Previous Cost $948.384

Daily Daily 945 Gals ement: sx DailyCost $23,323
Cum. 31.3 hrs Cum. 25458 Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost

MPPI MSC Exploration
ne ' Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease andWellNo. CentractRio Ë$ Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date
E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 40 39 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 5, 2004

MD TVD Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative

9,182 9,182 232 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operption Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: Yes No g,gglyp[g ag Operator 1 8/6/04 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth it

Sky: No Pass? O Yes O No Service 2 9/6/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Settint Depth LinerTop MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT, SPEED AÑDHIDRAULICSRË(ORD
BIT Blt Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

13 7/7/8" Smith S65 MH4210 14,15,15 8,700' 482' 46 30 105 10.5

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

466 166 1:8 Ab0
Pump

Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Uner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump © mg #3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9x6 3.15 98 291 2150 192 130 249 1/2 60 630

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 489' Description:

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'),6- 61/4" DC (176.18') - 2218'of 3.5'" S135 DP

Mudmotor .24*98 stk= 70 rpm, 35 rot table= 105 rpm on bit
MUDbATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT 8.9 49 21 22 10/22 6.2 2 4 0.33 12.6 10 0.3 .2/1.5

Šmpi E.L

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours MudEngineer Mud Company

10000 200 00 122 #1 #2 Desand Cent.

2 % KCL 145 451 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Deslit Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

145 24 $4,010 $90,297

DIRECŸIOÑALsbRVEYS

OPERAT ONS SUilMARY
TIME Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0800 2.0 5 Drillto 8976' Time St mmary

0800 0830 0.5 17 Service rig Activity Daily Cum.

0830 1430 6.0 5 Drillto 9036' 1. Mob/DeMob 75

1430 1630 2.0 15 Circulate pull 2 stands, change out kelly swivel, TlH 2. Cement 2.5

1630 0600 13.5 5 Drillto 9182' 3. Circulate 13.5

4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 21.5 465

6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. Drill Cmt.lLOT 3
11. N.U.I N.D.
12. P.tJ./L.D. BHA 13

13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale -0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 2 38.25

Morrison - 2680' Curtis (MoabTongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 0.5 11

Navojo - 3843' Kayenta -4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5

Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 17.5

Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' 21. Trips 93.25

22. Tst. BOPs 5

no new shows 23. UR/HO

BG = 4-12 units RECO VE 24. W.O.W.

CG = 14 units 25. Wash & Ream 30.5

TG - 0 units 26. WellControl

MFG = 0 units 27. WOC 12.5

o lhi 28. Other 46.75

Da UPOiL,or " Total 24 889.25

Total dours 24.0
Rig Dcuntime Fuel Usage ulk Material on Board Previous Cost $948.384

Daily Daily 945 Gals ement: sx DailyCost $23,323
Cum. 31.3 hrs Cum. 25458 Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

BIpck, Lease and Well Ng. Contract Rig R _DË& Date on Location Soud Date Resort Date
E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 39 38 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 4, 2004

M_O TV__D Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TQ. Company Repreëentativ9
8,950 8,950 225 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher
Drilling Rig Fax; 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes LB No LCSO Sample Date Operator 1 8/6/04 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? Ü Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? Yes No Service 2 9/6/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H (DRAULICS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
13 7/7/8" Smith S65 MH4210 14,15,15 8,700' 250' 24 1/2 25/27 100 10.2

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
419 166 138 160

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
NO Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 100 297 2000 130 249 1/2 60 610
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 489' Description:

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')
Mud motor .24* 100 stk= 71 rpm, 29 rot table = 100 rpm on bit

Smpl Ë.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PIÌ 10000 400 100 120 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2 % KCL 145 145 16 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 24 $3Åi6 $86,28;

MD TVD ANGLE VS
8808 8808 4.25 °

JPERATIJNS SUlk MARY
iãE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1300 7.0 5 Drillto 8790' Time St mmary
1300 1330 0.5 17 Service rig Activity Daily Cum.
1330 2200 8.5 5 Drillto 8883' 1. Mob/DeMob 75
2200 2300 1.0 20 Survey 808' - 4.25 deg 2. Cement 2.5
2300 0600 7.0 5 Drillto 8950' 3. Circulate 13.5

4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 22.5 443.5
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt.ILOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.

2221.18' IF S135 3.5" drill pipe 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 36.25
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 0.5 10.5
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 1 17.5
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim -7296' 21. Trips 93.25

22. Tst. BOPs 5
Oil shale 8745' - 8750', mid yellowcut 23. UR/HO
BG = 4-12 units 24. W.O.W.
CG = 24 units 25. Wash & Ream 30.5
TG - 0 units 26. Well Control
M FG = 60 units 27. WOC 12.5

28. Other 46.75

Total iours 24.0
Rig Do vntime Fuel Usage ulk Material on Board Previous Cost $917,539Daily Daily 840 Gals ement: sx Daily Cost $30,845Cum. 31.3 hrs Cum. 24513 Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost

PPI MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

BIpck, Lease and Well Ng. Contract Rig R _DË& Date on Location Soud Date Resort Date
E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 39 38 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 4, 2004

M_O TV__D Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TQ. Company Repreëentativ9
8,950 8,950 225 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher
Drilling Rig Fax; 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes LB No LCSO Sample Date Operator 1 8/6/04 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? Ü Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? Yes No Service 2 9/6/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H (DRAULICS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
13 7/7/8" Smith S65 MH4210 14,15,15 8,700' 250' 24 1/2 25/27 100 10.2

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
419 166 138 160

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
NO Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 100 297 2000 130 249 1/2 60 610
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 489' Description:

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18')
Mud motor .24* 100 stk= 71 rpm, 29 rot table = 100 rpm on bit

Smpl Ë.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PIÌ 10000 400 100 120 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2 % KCL 145 145 16 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 24 $3Åi6 $86,28;

MD TVD ANGLE VS
8808 8808 4.25 °

JPERATIJNS SUlk MARY
iãE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1300 7.0 5 Drillto 8790' Time St mmary
1300 1330 0.5 17 Service rig Activity Daily Cum.
1330 2200 8.5 5 Drillto 8883' 1. Mob/DeMob 75
2200 2300 1.0 20 Survey 808' - 4.25 deg 2. Cement 2.5
2300 0600 7.0 5 Drillto 8950' 3. Circulate 13.5

4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 22.5 443.5
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt.ILOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.

2221.18' IF S135 3.5" drill pipe 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 36.25
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 0.5 10.5
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 1 17.5
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim -7296' 21. Trips 93.25

22. Tst. BOPs 5
Oil shale 8745' - 8750', mid yellowcut 23. UR/HO
BG = 4-12 units 24. W.O.W.
CG = 24 units 25. Wash & Ream 30.5
TG - 0 units 26. Well Control
M FG = 60 units 27. WOC 12.5

28. Other 46.75

Total iours 24.0
Rig Do vntime Fuel Usage ulk Material on Board Previous Cost $917,539Daily Daily 840 Gals ement: sx Daily Cost $30,845Cum. 31.3 hrs Cum. 24513 Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
ne * DailyOrilIIng Report

Block.Lease and WellNo. Cofib%ëtSID gg QEi Date on Location Soud Date RODort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Unlon#7 42 41 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 7, 2004

TVJ Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative

9,422 9,422 32 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present ODeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

POOH to change to 3-1/2" Drl11pipe Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 18 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: U Yes U No | C50 Sample Date Operator i 8/6/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes No Service 6 9/6/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED AND HIDRAULICSRELORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearíng Gage

13 7 7/8" Smith S65 MH4210 14.15,15 8,700' 722' 73 1/2 28 105 9.8

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

46b 1/6 ir b 168

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM

pps 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 98 291 2350 249 139 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 489' Description: bit, 1- mud motor (28.64'), 1-IBS(3.07)- 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.85'), 1 IBS (3.90'), 7 - DC 6 1/4" (337.05')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18') - 3.5"' S135 DP

Mudmotor .24*98 stk= 70 rpm, 35 rot table = 105 rpm on bit

MUDDATA
WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT 8. 48 24 15 9/17 6.2 4 0.33 12.3 10 0.3 .25/1.4

$mpi F.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

11600 80 92 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2% KCL 145 145 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Deslit Mud Cl Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 24 $3,986 $98,028

9330 9330 4.00 *

OPERATIONSSU 1MARY

A Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0800 2.0 5 Drillto 9405' Time St mmary

0800 0900 1.0 20 Survey @9330' - 4 deg Activity Daily Cum.

0900 0930 0.5 17 Service rig 1. Mob/DeMob 75

0930 1200 2.5 5 Drillto 9422' 2. Cement 2.5

1200 1730 5.5 3 Circulate and condition to lay down 4.5" DP. Mix biocide. Unioad pipe 3. Circulate 6.5 20

Strap 3.5" DP. Swaco set centrifuge wl crane before laydown machine 4. Directional Work

could rig up. 5. Drilling 4.5 492.5

1730 1800 0.5 21 Rig up lay down machine. Unioad and strap 3.5" DP. 6. Drive Pipe

1800 1900 1.0 3 Circulate and pump pill 7. Fishing 53

1900 2000 1.0 21 TOOH, Lay down 4.5" DP 8. OH Logging

2000 2030 0.5 15 Repair air line 9. Lost Circ.

2030 0200 5.5 21 TOOH, Lay down 4.5" DP 10. DrillCmt./LOT 3

0200 0300 1.0 15 Repair broken hydraulic line 11. N.U,/ N.D.

0300 0400 1.0 21 TOOH, Lay down2 jtsof 4.5" DP, rig down lay down machine 12. P.U,/L.D. BHA 13

0400 0500 1.0 21 TOOH 3.5" DP 13. P.U,lL.D. Pipe

0500 0530 0.5 15 Repair hydraulic lines 14. R/U;R/D 2.5

0530 0600 0.5 21 TOOH wl 3.5" DP 15. Rig Repair 2 40.25

16. Run Casing 6.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 17. Service Rig 0.5 12.5

Morrison- 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5

Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 20. Survey 1 18.5

Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 21. Trips 9.5 102.75

Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 22 Tst. BOPs 5

Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' 23. UR/HO

CG = 43 units 27. WOC 12.5

TG -0 units Og Aas A NWb 28. Other 46.75

MFG = 0 units Total 24 937.25

Total dours 24.0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $995,872

Daily 2.0 hrs Daily 798 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $21,954
Cum. 33.3 hrs Cum. 27180 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

PPI MSC Exploration
ne * DailyOrilIIng Report

Block.Lease and WellNo. Cofib%ëtSID gg QEi Date on Location Soud Date RODort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Unlon#7 42 41 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 7, 2004

TVJ Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative

9,422 9,422 32 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present ODeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

POOH to change to 3-1/2" Drl11pipe Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 18 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: U Yes U No | C50 Sample Date Operator i 8/6/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes No Service 6 9/6/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED AND HIDRAULICSRELORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearíng Gage

13 7 7/8" Smith S65 MH4210 14.15,15 8,700' 722' 73 1/2 28 105 9.8

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

46b 1/6 ir b 168

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM

pps 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 98 291 2350 249 139 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 489' Description: bit, 1- mud motor (28.64'), 1-IBS(3.07)- 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.85'), 1 IBS (3.90'), 7 - DC 6 1/4" (337.05')

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18') - 3.5"' S135 DP

Mudmotor .24*98 stk= 70 rpm, 35 rot table = 105 rpm on bit

MUDDATA
WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT 8. 48 24 15 9/17 6.2 4 0.33 12.3 10 0.3 .25/1.4

$mpi F.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

11600 80 92 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2% KCL 145 145 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Deslit Mud Cl Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 24 $3,986 $98,028

9330 9330 4.00 *

OPERATIONSSU 1MARY

A Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0800 2.0 5 Drillto 9405' Time St mmary

0800 0900 1.0 20 Survey @9330' - 4 deg Activity Daily Cum.

0900 0930 0.5 17 Service rig 1. Mob/DeMob 75

0930 1200 2.5 5 Drillto 9422' 2. Cement 2.5

1200 1730 5.5 3 Circulate and condition to lay down 4.5" DP. Mix biocide. Unioad pipe 3. Circulate 6.5 20

Strap 3.5" DP. Swaco set centrifuge wl crane before laydown machine 4. Directional Work

could rig up. 5. Drilling 4.5 492.5

1730 1800 0.5 21 Rig up lay down machine. Unioad and strap 3.5" DP. 6. Drive Pipe

1800 1900 1.0 3 Circulate and pump pill 7. Fishing 53

1900 2000 1.0 21 TOOH, Lay down 4.5" DP 8. OH Logging

2000 2030 0.5 15 Repair air line 9. Lost Circ.

2030 0200 5.5 21 TOOH, Lay down 4.5" DP 10. DrillCmt./LOT 3

0200 0300 1.0 15 Repair broken hydraulic line 11. N.U,/ N.D.

0300 0400 1.0 21 TOOH, Lay down2 jtsof 4.5" DP, rig down lay down machine 12. P.U,/L.D. BHA 13

0400 0500 1.0 21 TOOH 3.5" DP 13. P.U,lL.D. Pipe

0500 0530 0.5 15 Repair hydraulic lines 14. R/U;R/D 2.5

0530 0600 0.5 21 TOOH wl 3.5" DP 15. Rig Repair 2 40.25

16. Run Casing 6.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 17. Service Rig 0.5 12.5

Morrison- 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5

Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 20. Survey 1 18.5

Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 21. Trips 9.5 102.75

Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 22 Tst. BOPs 5

Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' 23. UR/HO

CG = 43 units 27. WOC 12.5

TG -0 units Og Aas A NWb 28. Other 46.75

MFG = 0 units Total 24 937.25

Total dours 24.0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $995,872

Daily 2.0 hrs Daily 798 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $21,954

Cum. 33.3 hrs Cum. 27180 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block. Leage and WellNg. Contract Riq & Qf_g Date on Location Soud Date Repert Date
E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 41 40 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 6, 2004

m Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative
9,390 9,390 208 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operatiçn Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes No m Operator 1 8/6/04 RKB 15 _ ft
Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: No Pass? Ü Yes O No Service 2 9/6/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICS RE(ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
13 7/7/8" Smith S66 MH4210 14,15,15 8,700° 690' 69 27 105 10.0

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT Hrs PU Wt SO Wt RO I Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 98 291 2300 192 249 139 1/2 59 840
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 489' Description:

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18') - 2218' of 3.5"' S135 DP
Mud motor .24* 98 stk= 70 rpm, 35 rot table = 105 rpm on bit

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT 9 50 21 26 12/.18 6.4 2 5 0.33 12.7 10 0.3 .25/1.25

Smpi l-.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PI I 11000 120 99 122 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2.2 %KCL 145 145 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 $3,)b6 494,0ti3

MD TvD ANGLE CLOSURE

1PERATl3NSSUlk MARY
iAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1030 4.5 5 Drillto 9221' Time St mmary
1030 1130 1.0 17 Service rig _ Activity Daily Cum.
1130 0600 18.5 5 Drillto 9390' 1. Mob/DeMob 75

2. Cement 2.5
3. Circulate 13.5
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 23 488
6. Drive Pige
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U.I N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 38.25
Morrison - 2680' Cultis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 1 12
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 17.5
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim -7296' 21. Trips 93.25

22. Tst. BOPs 5
no new shows 23. UR/HO
BG = 12-27 units 24. W.O.W.
CG = 40 units 25. Wash & Ream 30.5
TG - 0 units 26. WellControl
M FG = 0 units 27. WOC 12.5

28. Other 46.75
Total 24 913.25Total lours 24.0

Rig DONntime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $971,707Daily Daily 924 Gals Cement sx Daily Cost $24,165Cum. 31.3 hrs Cum. 26382 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

PPI MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block. Leage and WellNg. Contract Riq & Qf_g Date on Location Soud Date Repert Date
E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 41 40 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 6, 2004

m Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative
9,390 9,390 208 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operatiçn Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes No m Operator 1 8/6/04 RKB 15 _ ft
Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: No Pass? Ü Yes O No Service 2 9/6/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICS RE(ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
13 7/7/8" Smith S66 MH4210 14,15,15 8,700° 690' 69 27 105 10.0

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT Hrs PU Wt SO Wt RO I Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 98 291 2300 192 249 139 1/2 59 840
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 489' Description:

1- 6 1/4" jars(30.23'), 6- 61/4" DC (176.18') - 2218' of 3.5"' S135 DP
Mud motor .24* 98 stk= 70 rpm, 35 rot table = 105 rpm on bit

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT 9 50 21 26 12/.18 6.4 2 5 0.33 12.7 10 0.3 .25/1.25

Smpi l-.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PI I 11000 120 99 122 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2.2 %KCL 145 145 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 $3,)b6 494,0ti3

MD TvD ANGLE CLOSURE

1PERATl3NSSUlk MARY
iAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1030 4.5 5 Drillto 9221' Time St mmary
1030 1130 1.0 17 Service rig _ Activity Daily Cum.
1130 0600 18.5 5 Drillto 9390' 1. Mob/DeMob 75

2. Cement 2.5
3. Circulate 13.5
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 23 488
6. Drive Pige
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U.I N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 38.25
Morrison - 2680' Cultis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 1 12
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 17.5
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim -7296' 21. Trips 93.25

22. Tst. BOPs 5
no new shows 23. UR/HO
BG = 12-27 units 24. W.O.W.
CG = 40 units 25. Wash & Ream 30.5
TG - 0 units 26. WellControl
M FG = 0 units 27. WOC 12.5

28. Other 46.75
Total 24 913.25Total lours 24.0

Rig DONntime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $971,707Daily Daily 924 Gals Cement sx Daily Cost $24,165Cum. 31.3 hrs Cum. 26382 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



MSCExplorationHi-sen*©' Daily Drilling Report
Block.Lease and WellNo. CorítractRid B Date on Location $Dud Date Reoort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat- State MSC#35-1 Union#7 44 43 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 9, 2004

TV Footaqe AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD, Company Representative

9,519 9,519 92 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Ooeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.; 16 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: Yes No LCSOSample Date Operator i 9/7/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: No Pass? O Yes No Service 4 10/7/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Settin Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHF,SËEED ANDH/DRAULiCSRECORD
BiT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearíng Gage

14 7 7/8" Smith S67Y MP4945 13.13,14 9,422' 97' 14 1/2 27 99 6.7

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROl Wt Torque

60 1AB 130 138

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 | Pump #2 Pump #3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 68 201 1900 163 174 91 1/2 56 1170

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 490' Description: bit, 1- mud motor (27.98'), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241.20'), 1- 6.25" jars (36.22'), 6- 6.25" DC (180.44'), XO (2.88'), XO (1.25')

Mud motor .24* 68 stk= 49 rpm, 50 rot table = 99 rpm on bit

MUDDATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OfL % SD % MBT H Pm Pf/Mf

PIT 9.1 4 22 19 11/17 6,6 2 5 0.33 12.7 9.5 0.3 .25/1.6

smpi Ë.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer MudCompany

fl A5000 360 102 120 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2 % KCL 145 145 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt MudCI DailyCost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIOÑALSUkVEYS
145 255 24 51,161 5100,139

VS

OPERATONS SUL1MARY

TI AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 1500 9.0 21 PU 3.5" DP. Wash to bottom. No fill. Time St mmary

1500 2200 7.0 5 Drillto 9460' Activity Daily Cum.

2200 2230 0.5 17 Semice rig 1. Mob/DeMob 75

2230 0600 7.5 5 Drillto 9515' 2. Cement 2.5

3. Circulate 20

4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 14.5 507
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13

13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. R/U;R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota2230' 15. Rig Repair 44.25

Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Entrada - 3263' Carme! - 3684' 17. Semice Rig 0.5 13

Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5

Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi -

5100° 20. Survey 18.5

Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' 21. Trips 9 121.75

22. Tst. BOPs 10

no new shows 23. UR/HO

BG = 8-24 units 24. W.O.W.

CG = 28 units 25. Wash & Ream 30.5

TG-10units DECEIVED 26.w..,contro,

M FG = 25 units 27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 51.75

Total 24 985.25

Total dours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulkMaterialon Board E"

. OFUIL,ban MB revious Cost $1,046,751

Daily Daily 672 Gals ement: sx Daily Cost $29,708

Cum. 37.3 brs Cum. 28272 Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost

MSCExplorationHi-sen*©' Daily Drilling Report
Block.Lease and WellNo. CorítractRid B Date on Location $Dud Date Reoort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat- State MSC#35-1 Union#7 44 43 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 9, 2004

TV Footaqe AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD, Company Representative

9,519 9,519 92 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Ooeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.; 16 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: Yes No LCSOSample Date Operator i 9/7/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: No Pass? O Yes No Service 4 10/7/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Settin Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHF,SËEED ANDH/DRAULiCSRECORD
BiT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearíng Gage

14 7 7/8" Smith S67Y MP4945 13.13,14 9,422' 97' 14 1/2 27 99 6.7

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROl Wt Torque

60 1AB 130 138

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 | Pump #2 Pump #3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 68 201 1900 163 174 91 1/2 56 1170

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 490' Description: bit, 1- mud motor (27.98'), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241.20'), 1- 6.25" jars (36.22'), 6- 6.25" DC (180.44'), XO (2.88'), XO (1.25')

Mud motor .24* 68 stk= 49 rpm, 50 rot table = 99 rpm on bit

MUDDATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OfL % SD % MBT H Pm Pf/Mf

PIT 9.1 4 22 19 11/17 6,6 2 5 0.33 12.7 9.5 0.3 .25/1.6

smpi Ë.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer MudCompany

fl A5000 360 102 120 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2 % KCL 145 145 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt MudCI DailyCost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIOÑALSUkVEYS
145 255 24 51,161 5100,139

VS

OPERATONS SUL1MARY

TI AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 1500 9.0 21 PU 3.5" DP. Wash to bottom. No fill. Time St mmary

1500 2200 7.0 5 Drillto 9460' Activity Daily Cum.

2200 2230 0.5 17 Semice rig 1. Mob/DeMob 75

2230 0600 7.5 5 Drillto 9515' 2. Cement 2.5

3. Circulate 20

4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 14.5 507

6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13

13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. R/U;R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota2230' 15. Rig Repair 44.25

Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Entrada - 3263' Carme! - 3684' 17. Semice Rig 0.5 13

Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5

Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi -

5100° 20. Survey 18.5

Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' 21. Trips 9 121.75

22. Tst. BOPs 10

no new shows 23. UR/HO

BG = 8-24 units 24. W.O.W.

CG = 28 units 25. Wash & Ream 30.5

TG-10units DECEIVED 26.w..,contro,

M FG = 25 units 27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 51.75

Total 24 985.25

Total dours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulkMaterialon Board E"

. OFUIL,ban MB revious Cost $1,046,751

Daily Daily 672 Gals ement: sx Daily Cost $29,708

Cum. 37.3 brs Cum. 28272 Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Explorationnå '
, Daily Drilling Report

Block, Leasó and WellNo. Contract Ria DOI _DËñ Date on Location Soud Date -Recort Date
E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 43 42 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 8, 2004

MD [¾ Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representptive
9,422 9,422 $827,000 8,500' Cad Hulslander

Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
TIH with3-1/2"drillingassembly Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 22 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: Ed Yes (__]No LC50 Sample Date Operator 1 9/7/2004 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth 11
Sky: No Pass? O Yes O No Service 10 10/7/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 S/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT, SPEED ANDH /DRAULCS REGORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
13 7 7/8" Smith S65 MH4210 14,15,15 8,700' 722' 73 1/2 28 105 9.8 3 8 I
14 7 7/8" Smith S67Y MP4945 13,13,14 9,422'
Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT.Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

.-.....

465
¯¯¯

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pump #3

gps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2
2 9 x 6 | 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 490 Description: bit, 1- mud motor (27.98'), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241.20'), 1- 6.25 ars (36 22') 6- 6 25" DC (180 44'), XO (2.88'), XO (1.25')

Mud motor .24* 98 stk= 70 rpm, 35 rot table = 105 rpm on bit

Smpi I L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pfl 11000 100 81 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2 %KCL 145 145 0.6 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Deslit Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 24 $960 $98,9/8

MD TVD CLOSURE

3PERAT ONS SUIUMARY
IAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1100 5.0 21 TOOH inspect BHA, L/D 3 DCs, jars, 1- IBS Time SL mmary
1100 1600 5.0 28 Installed 3.5" pipe rams, L/D 4.5" kelly, PU 3.5" kelly. Activity Daily Cum.
1600 2100 5.0 22 Test BOPs. Rams, choke, kill lines, kelly, safety valve, manifold = 3000 psi 1. Mob/DeMob 75

10 mins - OK, low 250 psi 5 mins. OK. Annular 1500 psi - 10 min - OK 2. Cement 2.5
Low 250 psi - 5 min OK, Alltested good 3. Circulate 20

2100 0100 4.0 15 Rig repair. Change out air compressor 4. Directional Work
0100 0430 3.5 21 PU new motor, jars, 3 DCs- TlH 5. Drilling 492.5
0430 0600 1.5 21 PU 3.5" DP. TIH 6. Drive Pipe

7. Fishing 53
DC inspection - 1 cracked box. 2 damaged faces, jars - cracked both ends 8. OH Logging
1 - IBS - cracked upset 9. Lost Circ.

10. DrlilCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 13. P.U.lL.D. Plpe
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 14. RIU; R/D 2.5
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta -4098' 15. Rig Repair 4 44.25
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 17. Service Rig 12.5
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' 18. Sidetrack Op.

19. Stuck Plpe 0.5
no new shows 20. Survey 18.5
BG = 12-30 units 21. Trips 10 112.75
CG = 43 units 22. Tst. BOPs 5 10
TG - 0 units 23. UR/HO
M FG = 0 units 24. W.O.W.

25. Wash & Ream 30.5
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 5 51.75

Total 24 961.25Total iours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $1,017,826

Daily 4.0 hrs Daily 420 Gals Cement: sx DailyCost $28,925Cum. 37.3 hrs Cum. 27600 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

PPI MSC Exploration
nå '

, Daily Drilling Report
Block, Leasó and WellNo. Contract Ria DOI _DËñ Date on Location Soud Date -Recort Date

E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 43 42 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 8, 2004
MD [¾ Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representptive

9,422 9,422 $827,000 8,500' Cad Hulslander
Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

TIH with3-1/2"drillingassembly Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 22 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: Ed Yes (__]No LC50 Sample Date Operator 1 9/7/2004 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth 11
Sky: No Pass? O Yes O No Service 10 10/7/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 S/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT, SPEED ANDH /DRAULCS REGORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
13 7 7/8" Smith S65 MH4210 14,15,15 8,700' 722' 73 1/2 28 105 9.8 3 8 I
14 7 7/8" Smith S67Y MP4945 13,13,14 9,422'
Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT.Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

.-.....

465
¯¯¯

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pump #3

gps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2
2 9 x 6 | 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 490 Description: bit, 1- mud motor (27.98'), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241.20'), 1- 6.25 ars (36 22') 6- 6 25" DC (180 44'), XO (2.88'), XO (1.25')

Mud motor .24* 98 stk= 70 rpm, 35 rot table = 105 rpm on bit

Smpi I L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pfl 11000 100 81 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2 %KCL 145 145 0.6 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Deslit Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 24 $960 $98,9/8

MD TVD CLOSURE

3PERAT ONS SUIUMARY
IAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1100 5.0 21 TOOH inspect BHA, L/D 3 DCs, jars, 1- IBS Time SL mmary
1100 1600 5.0 28 Installed 3.5" pipe rams, L/D 4.5" kelly, PU 3.5" kelly. Activity Daily Cum.
1600 2100 5.0 22 Test BOPs. Rams, choke, kill lines, kelly, safety valve, manifold = 3000 psi 1. Mob/DeMob 75

10 mins - OK, low 250 psi 5 mins. OK. Annular 1500 psi - 10 min - OK 2. Cement 2.5
Low 250 psi - 5 min OK, Alltested good 3. Circulate 20

2100 0100 4.0 15 Rig repair. Change out air compressor 4. Directional Work
0100 0430 3.5 21 PU new motor, jars, 3 DCs- TlH 5. Drilling 492.5
0430 0600 1.5 21 PU 3.5" DP. TIH 6. Drive Pipe

7. Fishing 53
DC inspection - 1 cracked box. 2 damaged faces, jars - cracked both ends 8. OH Logging
1 - IBS - cracked upset 9. Lost Circ.

10. DrlilCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 13. P.U.lL.D. Plpe
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 14. RIU; R/D 2.5
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta -4098' 15. Rig Repair 4 44.25
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 17. Service Rig 12.5
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' 18. Sidetrack Op.

19. Stuck Plpe 0.5
no new shows 20. Survey 18.5
BG = 12-30 units 21. Trips 10 112.75
CG = 43 units 22. Tst. BOPs 5 10
TG - 0 units 23. UR/HO
M FG = 0 units 24. W.O.W.

25. Wash & Ream 30.5
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 5 51.75

Total 24 961.25Total iours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $1,017,826

Daily 4.0 hrs Daily 420 Gals Cement: sx DailyCost $28,925Cum. 37.3 hrs Cum. 27600 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
Dgy þrillinggeport

Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria D.O.L DE Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 46 45 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 11, 2004

gg M Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Comoanv Reoresentative
9,812 9,812 115 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operatien Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher
TIHwithnew bit Rlg Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

CurrentWeather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: LJ Yes É No Operator 1 9/7/04 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? U Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: Ü No Pass? O Yes No Service 2 10/7/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth LinerTop MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT,SPEED AND H 'DRAULCS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

14 7 7/8" SmithS67Y MP4945 13,13,14 9,422' 390' 52 27/30 100 7.5 2 3 I

15 7 7/8" Reed HP 52A P70411 13,14,14 9,812'

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt RO1 Wt Torque

544.5 ib0 134 141
Pump Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 70 208 2480 153 174 91 1/2 53 1270

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 490' Description: bit, 1- mud motor (27.98'), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241.20'),1- 6.25" jars (36 22 ),6- 6.25" DC (180.44'), XO (2.88'), XO (1.25')

Mud motor .24*70 stk= 50 rpm, 50 rot table = 99 rpmon bit

smpt I-.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pli 11000 100 102 118 #1 #2 Desand Cent.

2% KCL 145 145 John Umon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Dally Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONALSURVEYS
255 24 53,466 $107,254

TvD VS CLOSURE

OPERATONS SUMMARY
TI AE Time Boats: SupplyBoat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 2000 14.0 5 Drillto 9812'. Pressure 2480 psi and rising Time St mmary

2000 2100 1.0 3 Circulate, Mixand pump pill Activity Daily Cum.

2100 0330 6.5 21 TOOH 1. Mob/DeMob 75

0330 0400 0.5 21 Change blt 2. Cement 2.5

0400 0500 1.0 17 Service rig. Test rams 3. Circulate 1 21

0500 0600 1.0 21 Lay down mud motor. Start in hole 4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 14 544.5
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3

Not able to pumpsufficientvolume to keep mud motorfrom staillnqout and 11. N.U.lN.D.

Increasing stand pipe pressure. 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 44.25

Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rip 1 14.5

Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5

Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Suivey 18.5

Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' Whlte Rim -7296' 21. Trips 8 129.75
22. Tst. BOPs 10

No shows 23. UR/HO

BG = 18 -30 units 24. W.O.W.

CG = 29 -38 units RM IVED 25. Wash & Ream 30.5

TG - 0 units 26. Well Control

M

Total 24 1033.25

Total iours 24.0 (,)
Rig Dcuntime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $1,110,204

Daily Daily 756 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $28,236
Cum. 37.3 hrs Cum. 29826 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

PPI MSC Exploration
Dgy þrillinggeport

Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria D.O.L DE Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 46 45 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 11, 2004

gg M Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Comoanv Reoresentative
9,812 9,812 115 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operatien Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher

TIHwithnew bit Rlg Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

CurrentWeather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: LJ Yes É No Operator 1 9/7/04 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? U Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: Ü No Pass? O Yes No Service 2 10/7/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth LinerTop MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT,SPEED AND H 'DRAULCS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

14 7 7/8" SmithS67Y MP4945 13,13,14 9,422' 390' 52 27/30 100 7.5 2 3 I

15 7 7/8" Reed HP 52A P70411 13,14,14 9,812'

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt RO1 Wt Torque

544.5 ib0 134 141
Pump Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 70 208 2480 153 174 91 1/2 53 1270

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 490' Description: bit, 1- mud motor (27.98'), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241.20'),1- 6.25" jars (36 22 ),6- 6.25" DC (180.44'), XO (2.88'), XO (1.25')

Mud motor .24*70 stk= 50 rpm, 50 rot table = 99 rpmon bit

smpt I-.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pli 11000 100 102 118 #1 #2 Desand Cent.

2% KCL 145 145 John Umon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Dally Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONALSURVEYS
255 24 53,466 $107,254

TvD VS CLOSURE

OPERATONS SUMMARY
TI AE Time Boats: SupplyBoat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 2000 14.0 5 Drillto 9812'. Pressure 2480 psi and rising Time St mmary

2000 2100 1.0 3 Circulate, Mixand pump pill Activity Daily Cum.

2100 0330 6.5 21 TOOH 1. Mob/DeMob 75

0330 0400 0.5 21 Change blt 2. Cement 2.5

0400 0500 1.0 17 Service rig. Test rams 3. Circulate 1 21

0500 0600 1.0 21 Lay down mud motor. Start in hole 4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 14 544.5

6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3

Not able to pumpsufficientvolume to keep mud motorfrom staillnqout and 11. N.U.lN.D.

Increasing stand pipe pressure. 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 44.25

Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rip 1 14.5

Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5

Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Suivey 18.5

Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' Whlte Rim -7296' 21. Trips 8 129.75
22. Tst. BOPs 10

No shows 23. UR/HO

BG = 18 -30 units 24. W.O.W.

CG = 29 -38 units RM IVED 25. Wash & Ream 30.5

TG - 0 units 26. Well Control

M

Total 24 1033.25

Total iours 24.0 (,)
Rig Dcuntime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $1,110,204

Daily Daily 756 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $28,236
Cum. 37.3 hrs Cum. 29826 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block, Lease and WellNo. ContractRio Q_Q.L _DJ Date on Looption Soud Date Reoort Date
E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 45 44 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 10, 2004

g B Footgqe AFE No. AFE Amount Auth.TD. Company Repreqentative
9,697 178 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operatiqn Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50 Sample Date Operator 1 9/7/04 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem7 O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? O Yes No Service 2 10/7/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED ANDH"DRAUL CS REC3RD
BlT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
14 7 7/8" Smith S67Y MP4945 13,13,14 9,422' 275' 38 27/30 100 7.2

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROi Wt To ue
530.6 160 134 141

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S ed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 70 208 2200 153 174 91 1/2 53 1270
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA

ILength: 490' Description: bit, 1- mud motor (27.98'), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241.20'), 1- 6.25" jars (36.22'), 6- 6.25" DC (180.44'), XO (2.88'), XO (1.25')
Mud motor .24*70 stk= 50 rpm, 50 rot table = 99 rpm on bit

Smpi F.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

ÑIl 11600 140 96 118 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2 %KCL 145 145 12 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONALSURVEYS
145 255 24 53,650 $103,789

MD TVD ANGLE

OPERAT ONS SUNMARY
¡AE Time Boats: SupplyBoat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 2330 17.5 5 Drillto 9651' Time St mmary
2330 0000 0.5 17 Service rig Activity Daily Cum.
0000 0600 6.0 5 Drillto 9697' 1. Mob/DeMob 75

2. Cement 2.5
3. Circulate 20
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 23.5 530.5
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH LoggIng
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrlilCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U.lL.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 44.25
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rip 0.5 13.5
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie- 4960' 19. Stuck Plpe 0.5
Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 18.5
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' 21. Trips 121.75

22. Tst. BOPs 10
Show- 26' (clay) show below - 9628' - 33' - 23. UR/HO
BG = 7 -230 units 24. W.O.W.
CG = 30 units 25. Wash & Ream 30.5
TG - 10 units 26. Well Control
M FG = 39 units 27. WOC 12.5

28. Other 51.75

Total iours 24.0
Total 24 1009.25

Rig Do.vntime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $1.076,459Daily Daily 798 Gals Cement: sx DailyCost $33,745Cum. 37.3 hrs Cum. 29070 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block, Lease and WellNo. ContractRio Q_Q.L _DJ Date on Looption Soud Date Reoort Date
E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 45 44 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 10, 2004

g B Footgqe AFE No. AFE Amount Auth.TD. Company Repreqentative
9,697 178 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operatiqn Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50 Sample Date Operator 1 9/7/04 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem7 O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? O Yes No Service 2 10/7/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED ANDH"DRAUL CS REC3RD
BlT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
14 7 7/8" Smith S67Y MP4945 13,13,14 9,422' 275' 38 27/30 100 7.2

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROi Wt To ue
530.6 160 134 141

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S ed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 70 208 2200 153 174 91 1/2 53 1270
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA

ILength: 490' Description: bit, 1- mud motor (27.98'), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241.20'), 1- 6.25" jars (36.22'), 6- 6.25" DC (180.44'), XO (2.88'), XO (1.25')
Mud motor .24*70 stk= 50 rpm, 50 rot table = 99 rpm on bit

Smpi F.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

ÑIl 11600 140 96 118 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2 %KCL 145 145 12 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONALSURVEYS
145 255 24 53,650 $103,789

MD TVD ANGLE

OPERAT ONS SUNMARY
¡AE Time Boats: SupplyBoat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 2330 17.5 5 Drillto 9651' Time St mmary
2330 0000 0.5 17 Service rig Activity Daily Cum.
0000 0600 6.0 5 Drillto 9697' 1. Mob/DeMob 75

2. Cement 2.5
3. Circulate 20
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 23.5 530.5
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH LoggIng
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrlilCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U.lL.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 44.25
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rip 0.5 13.5
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie- 4960' 19. Stuck Plpe 0.5
Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 18.5
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' 21. Trips 121.75

22. Tst. BOPs 10
Show- 26' (clay) show below - 9628' - 33' - 23. UR/HO
BG = 7 -230 units 24. W.O.W.
CG = 30 units 25. Wash & Ream 30.5
TG - 10 units 26. Well Control
M FG = 39 units 27. WOC 12.5

28. Other 51.75

Total iours 24.0
Total 24 1009.25

Rig Do.vntime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $1.076,459Daily Daily 798 Gals Cement: sx DailyCost $33,745Cum. 37.3 hrs Cum. 29070 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



OIO
MSC ExplorationEservinces* Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria 9.96 0.E.1 Date on Location Soud Date ReDort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 48 47 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 13, 2004

M Footage AFE NO. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representytive

10,158 10,158 195 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operption Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES Peopleon Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: LJ Yes No Operator 1 9/7/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass7 O Yes O No Service 2 10/7/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED ANDH TDRAUECSRECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

15 7 7/8" Reed HP 52A P70411 13,14,14 9,812' 346' 37 27/30 80 9.4

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

bSib 1b6 136 144

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

ggs DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 5.5 3.64 85 224 2240 158 178 92 1/2 50 700

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

LHe
gth: 463.6' Description: bit, bit sub(4.21), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241.20'), 1- 6 25" jars (36.22'), 6-6.25" DC (177.44'), XO (2.88'), XO (1.25')

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT 9 5 23 22 8/18 6.3 2 5 0.25 12. 10 0.3 6/2

Šmpi Ë.L.

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pil 14000 100 98 118 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2.3% KCL 145 145 24 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost CumulativeCost

DIRLŸlONALSURVEYS
145 255 24 Ë2,61b $112,136

OPERAT ONS SUC1MARY

AL Time Boats: SupplyBoat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 2200 16.0 5 Drillto 10105' Time SL mmary

2200 2230 0.5 17 Service rig, Operate pipe rams Activity Daily Cum.

2230 0600 7.5 5 Drillto 10158' 1. Mob/DeMob 75

2. Cement 2.5

3. Circulate 22

4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 23.5 581.5

6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 53

8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. Drill Cmt./LOT 3

11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13

13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. RIU, RIO 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 46.25

Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Senrice Rig 0.5 15.5

Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5

Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 20.5

Moenkopi(Sinbad) 6405' WhiteRim -7296' 21. Trlps 134.75

22. Tst. BOPs 10

No shows RECHVED 23. UR/HO

BG = 8 - 30 units 24. W.O.W.

M FG = 0 units 27. WOC 12.5

DW UFUILGAS&MINlble 28 oth•r 6176
Total 24 1081.25

TotaEdours 24.0
Rig Dcuntime Fuel Usage ulkMaterlaf on Board Previous Cost $1,157,689

Daily Daily 840 Gals ement: sx Daily Cost $20,179

Cum. 37.3 hrs Cum. 31212 Gals arite: s× Cum. Cost

OIO
MSC ExplorationEservinces* Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria 9.96 0.E.1 Date on Location Soud Date ReDort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 48 47 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 13, 2004

M Footage AFE NO. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representytive

10,158 10,158 195 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operption Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES Peopleon Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: LJ Yes No Operator 1 9/7/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass7 O Yes O No Service 2 10/7/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED ANDH TDRAUECSRECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

15 7 7/8" Reed HP 52A P70411 13,14,14 9,812' 346' 37 27/30 80 9.4

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

bSib 1b6 136 144

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

ggs DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 5.5 3.64 85 224 2240 158 178 92 1/2 50 700

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

LHe
gth: 463.6' Description: bit, bit sub(4.21), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241.20'), 1- 6 25" jars (36.22'), 6-6.25" DC (177.44'), XO (2.88'), XO (1.25')

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT 9 5 23 22 8/18 6.3 2 5 0.25 12. 10 0.3 6/2

Šmpi Ë.L.

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pil 14000 100 98 118 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2.3% KCL 145 145 24 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost CumulativeCost

DIRLŸlONALSURVEYS
145 255 24 Ë2,61b $112,136

OPERAT ONS SUC1MARY

AL Time Boats: SupplyBoat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 2200 16.0 5 Drillto 10105' Time SL mmary

2200 2230 0.5 17 Service rig, Operate pipe rams Activity Daily Cum.

2230 0600 7.5 5 Drillto 10158' 1. Mob/DeMob 75

2. Cement 2.5

3. Circulate 22

4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 23.5 581.5

6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 53

8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. Drill Cmt./LOT 3

11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13

13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. RIU, RIO 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 46.25

Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Senrice Rig 0.5 15.5

Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5

Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 20.5

Moenkopi(Sinbad) 6405' WhiteRim -7296' 21. Trlps 134.75

22. Tst. BOPs 10

No shows RECHVED 23. UR/HO

BG = 8 - 30 units 24. W.O.W.

M FG = 0 units 27. WOC 12.5

DW UFUILGAS&MINlble 28 oth•r 6176

Total 24 1081.25

TotaEdours 24.0
Rig Dcuntime Fuel Usage ulkMaterlaf on Board Previous Cost $1,157,689

Daily Daily 840 Gals ement: sx Daily Cost $20,179

Cum. 37.3 hrs Cum. 31212 Gals arite: s× Cum. Cost



PPI MSCExploration
Daily Drilling Report

Bleck,Lease andWell No. Contract Ria ROL REâ Date on Location Soud Date Report Date
E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 . ,47 46 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 12, 2004

Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth.TD, CompanyRepresentative
9,963 9,963 151 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Çperation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher
Drilling Rig Fax; 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes No LC50 Sample Date Operator 1 9/7/04 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: No Pass? O Yes O No Service 2 10/7/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 KSS STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED ANDH DRAULCS REC3RD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
15 7 7/8" Reed HP 52A P70411 13,14,14 9,812' 151' 13 1/2 27/30 85 11.2

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT.Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROl Wt rge

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 Pump #3

gps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 5.5 3.64 85 224 1890 153 174 91 1/2 45 660
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 463.6' Description: bit, bit sub(4 21), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241 20'), 1- 6.25" jars (36 22'), 6- 6 25" DC (177.44'), XO (2 88'), XO (1 25')

M

Šmpi .L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pfl 12000 200 102 119 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2.1 % KCL 145 145 18 John Limon M-!

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 255 24 Š2,266 109.620

MD TVD VS CLOSURE
9903' 9903' 3.50 *

OPERAT ONS SUNMARY
TIulE Time Boats: SupplyBoat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0900 3.0 21 TlH to 514' Time St mmary
0900 1000 1.0 3 Circulate Activity Daily Cum.
1000 1200 2.0 21 TIH to TD 1. Mob/DeMob 75
1200 1230 0.5 S Drillto 9817' 2. Cement 2.5
1230 1430 2.0 15 Rig repair. Replace chain on drum ball wheel 3. Circulate 1 22
1430 2230 8.0 5 Drillto 9913' * 4. Directional Work
2230 2330 1.0 20 Circulate 9871: Miss run 5. Drilling 13.5 558
2330 0000 0.5 17 Service rig. Function annulars 6. Drive Pipe
0000 0330 3.5 5 Drillto 9945' 7. Fishing 53
0330 0430 1.0 20 Survey 9903' - 3.5 deg 8. OH Logging
0430 0600 1.5 5 Drillto 9963' 9. Lost Circ.

10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.

Changed liners in #1 pump to 5-1/2" to increase volume. 12. P.U.lL.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - O' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 2 46.25
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rip 0.5 15
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 2 20.5
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim -7296' 21. Trips 5 134.75

22. Tst. BOPs 10
No shows 23. UR/HO
BG = 8 - 30 units 24. W.O.W.
CG = 21 - 36 units 25. Wash & Ream 30.5
TG - 60 units 26. Well Control
M FG = 0 units 27. WOC 12.5
Trip gas bubbled, short flow over BOP 28. Other . 51.75

Total 24 1057.25Total iours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious Cost $1,138,440Daily Daily 546 Gals Cement sx allyCost $19.249Cum. 37.3 hrs Cum. 30372 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost

PPI MSCExploration
Daily Drilling Report

Bleck,Lease andWell No. Contract Ria ROL REâ Date on Location Soud Date Report Date
E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 . ,47 46 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 12, 2004

Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth.TD, CompanyRepresentative
9,963 9,963 151 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Çperation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher
Drilling Rig Fax; 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes No LC50 Sample Date Operator 1 9/7/04 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: No Pass? O Yes O No Service 2 10/7/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 KSS STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED ANDH DRAULCS REC3RD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
15 7 7/8" Reed HP 52A P70411 13,14,14 9,812' 151' 13 1/2 27/30 85 11.2

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT.Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROl Wt rge

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 Pump #3

gps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 5.5 3.64 85 224 1890 153 174 91 1/2 45 660
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 463.6' Description: bit, bit sub(4 21), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241 20'), 1- 6.25" jars (36 22'), 6- 6 25" DC (177.44'), XO (2 88'), XO (1 25')

M

Šmpi .L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pfl 12000 200 102 119 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2.1 % KCL 145 145 18 John Limon M-!

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 255 24 Š2,266 109.620

MD TVD VS CLOSURE
9903' 9903' 3.50 *

OPERAT ONS SUNMARY
TIulE Time Boats: SupplyBoat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0900 3.0 21 TlH to 514' Time St mmary
0900 1000 1.0 3 Circulate Activity Daily Cum.
1000 1200 2.0 21 TIH to TD 1. Mob/DeMob 75
1200 1230 0.5 S Drillto 9817' 2. Cement 2.5
1230 1430 2.0 15 Rig repair. Replace chain on drum ball wheel 3. Circulate 1 22
1430 2230 8.0 5 Drillto 9913' * 4. Directional Work
2230 2330 1.0 20 Circulate 9871: Miss run 5. Drilling 13.5 558
2330 0000 0.5 17 Service rig. Function annulars 6. Drive Pipe
0000 0330 3.5 5 Drillto 9945' 7. Fishing 53
0330 0430 1.0 20 Survey 9903' - 3.5 deg 8. OH Logging
0430 0600 1.5 5 Drillto 9963' 9. Lost Circ.

10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.

Changed liners in #1 pump to 5-1/2" to increase volume. 12. P.U.lL.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - O' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 2 46.25
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rip 0.5 15
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 2 20.5
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim -7296' 21. Trips 5 134.75

22. Tst. BOPs 10
No shows 23. UR/HO
BG = 8 - 30 units 24. W.O.W.
CG = 21 - 36 units 25. Wash & Ream 30.5
TG - 60 units 26. Well Control
M FG = 0 units 27. WOC 12.5
Trip gas bubbled, short flow over BOP 28. Other . 51.75

Total 24 1057.25Total iours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious Cost $1,138,440Daily Daily 546 Gals Cement sx allyCost $19.249Cum. 37.3 hrs Cum. 30372 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
L$$ Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease and WellNo. Contridf RIE QQL Q.E,ft Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat- State MSC#35-1 Union#7 50 49 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 15, 2004

MR R Footage AFE No. AFE Amoynt Ailth.TD. Company Representative

10,450 10,450 154 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Oneration RigPhone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: Yes No grpg Operator 1 9/7/2004 RKB 15 it

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes No Service 2 10/7/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Settint Depth LinerTop MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT,SPEED ANDH 'DRAULCS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

15 7 7/8" Reed HP 52A P70411 13,14,14 9,812' 484' 54 1/2 28/30 80 8.9 3 4 1/8

16 7 7/8" Hughes GX 20 5057252 14,14,15 10,296' 154' 14 1/2 28/30 80 10.6

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT.Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

613.5 160 132 144

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 Pump #3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 5.5 3.64 85 224 2190 146 180 94 1/2 50 870

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

LHe
gth: 463.6' Description: bit, bit sub(4.21), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241.20'), 1- 6.25" jars (36.22'), 6-6.25" DC (177.44'), XO (2.88'), XO (1.25')

Smpi P.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PI 13000 80 101 1Ab #1 #2 Desand Cent.

2% KCL 145 145 24 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI DallyCost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONALSURVEYS
145 255 24 $$,933 117,121

MD ANGLE VS CLOSURE

OPERATONS SUliMARY

AL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0700 1.0 21 TOOH, survey miss run Time St mmary

0700 1500 8.0 21 TlH Activity Daily Cum.

1500 0200 11.0 5 Drillto 10423' 1. Mob/DeMob 75

0200 0230 0.5 17 Service rig 2. Cement 2.5

0230 0600 3.5 5 Drillto 10450' 3. Circulate 22
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 14.5 613.5
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13

13. P.U.lL.D.Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

MorrisonShale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 46.25

Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 0.5 16

Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5

Shinarump - 5060' . Mownkppi - 5100' 20. Sunrey 21

Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' 21. Trips 9 149.75

RECEIVED " '"°" '°

Show g 10301'-10344', pale yellowcut 23. UR/HO

Show@ 10365'-10376', pale yellow cut 24. W.O.W.

BG = 17 - 50 units DECI3 2004 25. Wash & Ream 30.5

CG = 26 -39 units 26. Well Control

M
Total 24 1129.25

Total dours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage BulkMaterialon Board Previous Cost $1,198.707

Daily Daily 672 Gals Cement: sx DailyCost $26,707

Cum. 37.3 hrs Cum. 32766 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost

PPI MSC Exploration
L$$ Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease and WellNo. Contridf RIE QQL Q.E,ft Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat- State MSC#35-1 Union#7 50 49 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 15, 2004

MR R Footage AFE No. AFE Amoynt Ailth.TD. Company Representative

10,450 10,450 154 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Oneration RigPhone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: Yes No grpg Operator 1 9/7/2004 RKB 15 it

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes No Service 2 10/7/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Settint Depth LinerTop MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT,SPEED ANDH 'DRAULCS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

15 7 7/8" Reed HP 52A P70411 13,14,14 9,812' 484' 54 1/2 28/30 80 8.9 3 4 1/8

16 7 7/8" Hughes GX 20 5057252 14,14,15 10,296' 154' 14 1/2 28/30 80 10.6

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT.Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

613.5 160 132 144

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 Pump #3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 5.5 3.64 85 224 2190 146 180 94 1/2 50 870

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

LHe
gth: 463.6' Description: bit, bit sub(4.21), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241.20'), 1- 6.25" jars (36.22'), 6-6.25" DC (177.44'), XO (2.88'), XO (1.25')

Smpi P.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PI 13000 80 101 1Ab #1 #2 Desand Cent.

2% KCL 145 145 24 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI DallyCost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONALSURVEYS
145 255 24 $$,933 117,121

MD ANGLE VS CLOSURE

OPERATONS SUliMARY

AL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0700 1.0 21 TOOH, survey miss run Time St mmary

0700 1500 8.0 21 TlH Activity Daily Cum.

1500 0200 11.0 5 Drillto 10423' 1. Mob/DeMob 75

0200 0230 0.5 17 Service rig 2. Cement 2.5

0230 0600 3.5 5 Drillto 10450' 3. Circulate 22

4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 14.5 613.5
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 53

8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13

13. P.U.lL.D.Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

MorrisonShale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 46.25

Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 0.5 16

Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5

Shinarump - 5060' . Mownkppi - 5100' 20. Sunrey 21

Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' 21. Trips 9 149.75

RECEIVED " '"°" '°

Show g 10301'-10344', pale yellowcut 23. UR/HO

Show@ 10365'-10376', pale yellow cut 24. W.O.W.

BG = 17 - 50 units DECI3 2004 25. Wash & Ream 30.5

CG = 26 -39 units 26. Well Control

M
Total 24 1129.25

Total dours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage BulkMaterialon Board Previous Cost $1,198.707

Daily Daily 672 Gals Cement: sx DailyCost $26,707

Cum. 37.3 hrs Cum. 32766 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



MSC Exploration
"$$ ' Daily Drilling Report

Block Lease and WellNo. Contract Riq g QEg Date on Location Soud Date Regort Date
E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 49 48 7/27/2004 .Jul 28, 2004 Sep 14, 2004

Mg TVD Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Rêpresentative
10,296 10,296 138 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Presênt Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
POOH for new bit Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc: 14 Last BOPTest Date RIGELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LCSOSample Date Operator 1 9/7/2004 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 .

Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? O Yes No Service 2 10/7/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED ANDH TDRAUL CS REcokb
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Foota e Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

15 7 7/8" Reed HP 52A P70411 13,14,14 9,812' 484' 54 1/2 28/30 80 8.9

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROI Wt Tor ue

BHA
Length: 463 6' Description: bit, bit sub(4 21), 8- 6 1/4 DC (241 20'), 1- 6 25" jars (36 22), 6- 6 25" DC (177.44), XO (2.88'), XO (1 25')

Smpi F.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Plf 13000 80 102 120 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2%KCL 145 145 24 JohnUmon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 255 24 53,053 5115,188

MD

OPERATONS SUllMARY
TIsAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 2330 17.5 5 Drillto 10296' Time St mmary
2330 0000 0.5 20 Drop survey Activity Daily Cum.
0000 0600 6.0 21 TOOH 1. Mob/DeMob 75

2. Cement 2.5
3. Circulate 22
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 17.5 599
6. Drive Plpe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; RID 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 46.25
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 15.5
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pige 0.5
Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 0.5 21
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' 21. Trips 6 140.75

22. Tst. BOPs 10
No shows 23. UR/HO
BG = 18 - 28 units 24. W.O.W.
CG = 0 units 25. Wash & Ream 30.5
TG - 0 units 26. Well Control
M FG = 0 units 27. WOC 12.5

28. Other 51.75
Total 24 1105.25

Total dours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious Cost $1,177,868

Daily Daily 882 Gals Cement: sx allyCost $20,839
Cum. 37.3 hrs Cum. 32094 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost

MSC Exploration
"$$ ' Daily Drilling Report

Block Lease and WellNo. Contract Riq g QEg Date on Location Soud Date Regort Date
E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 49 48 7/27/2004 .Jul 28, 2004 Sep 14, 2004

Mg TVD Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Rêpresentative
10,296 10,296 138 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Presênt Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
POOH for new bit Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc: 14 Last BOPTest Date RIGELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LCSOSample Date Operator 1 9/7/2004 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 .

Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? O Yes No Service 2 10/7/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED ANDH TDRAUL CS REcokb
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Foota e Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

15 7 7/8" Reed HP 52A P70411 13,14,14 9,812' 484' 54 1/2 28/30 80 8.9

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROI Wt Tor ue

BHA
Length: 463 6' Description: bit, bit sub(4 21), 8- 6 1/4 DC (241 20'), 1- 6 25" jars (36 22), 6- 6 25" DC (177.44), XO (2.88'), XO (1 25')

Smpi F.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Plf 13000 80 102 120 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2%KCL 145 145 24 JohnUmon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 255 24 53,053 5115,188

MD

OPERATONS SUllMARY
TIsAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 2330 17.5 5 Drillto 10296' Time St mmary
2330 0000 0.5 20 Drop survey Activity Daily Cum.
0000 0600 6.0 21 TOOH 1. Mob/DeMob 75

2. Cement 2.5
3. Circulate 22
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 17.5 599
6. Drive Plpe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; RID 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 46.25
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 15.5
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pige 0.5
Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 0.5 21
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' 21. Trips 6 140.75

22. Tst. BOPs 10
No shows 23. UR/HO
BG = 18 - 28 units 24. W.O.W.
CG = 0 units 25. Wash & Ream 30.5
TG - 0 units 26. Well Control
M FG = 0 units 27. WOC 12.5

28. Other 51.75
Total 24 1105.25

Total dours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious Cost $1,177,868

Daily Daily 882 Gals Cement: sx allyCost $20,839
Cum. 37.3 hrs Cum. 32094 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration 00MF\DENTIAL
i ,

E Daily Drilling Report
Block.Lease and WellNo. CdtitrkctRio 09.6 D.Eg Date on Location Snud Date Reoort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 52 51 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 17, 2004

g TV_Q Footaae AFg Nn AFEAmount Auth.TD Companv Representative

10,712 10,712 52 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Ooeration RigPhone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

TIH withnew bit RigFax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

CurrentWeather DÓNRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 18 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: U Yes U No g.§¾gtg Operator 5 9/7/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes j No Service 2 10/7/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT, SPËËD AND H3DRAUt CS kËCORD

BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

16 7 7/8" Hughes GX 20 5057252 14,14,15 10,296 412' 44 30 80 9.4 2 7
_

I

17 7 7/8" Reed HP 52 P70419 16,16,16 10,712

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

643 162 136 148

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV g SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

........ ....... ................ ...f.f.. ..
...

DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 5.5 2.64 85 224 2680 137 169 188 1/2 55 1220

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

LHe
gth: 463 6' Description: bit, bit sub(4.21), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241.20'), 1- 6.25" jars (36.22'), 6- 6.25" DC (177 44'), XO (2.88'), XO (1.25')

Smpi P.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

lË 11000 80 91 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2% KCL 145 145 24 John Umon M-I

#3 #4 DeslIt MudCI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONALSU IVEYS
145 255 24 4,212 $124,312

Ñ\b ÝVD ANGLE Direction Coordinates VS DL CLOSURE

10712 10712 4.00 °

OPERATONS SUllMARY

TI AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 1130 5.5 5 Drillto 10708' Tlme St mmary

1130 1230 1.0 17 Service rig Activity Daily Cum.

1230 1330 1.0 5 Drillto 10712' 1. Mob/DeMob 75

1330 1430 1.0 3 Circulate, Pump pilldrop survey 2. Cement 2.5

1430 2300 8.5 21 TOOH 3. Circulate 1 23

2300 0500 6.0 21 PU bit #17 &T1H 4. Ofrectional Work

0500 0600 1.0 15 Rig repair. Transmission filters 5. Drilling 6.5 643
6. Drive Plpe
7. Fishing 53

8. OHLogging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrlliCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; RID 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 1 47.25

Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 1 18

Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Plpe 0.5

Shinerump - 5060' Mownkopi- 5100' 20.ßurvey . 21

Moenkopi(Sinbad)6405' WhiteRim -7296° 21. Trips 14.5 164.25
22. Tst. BOPs 10
23. UR/HO

No new shows 24. W.O.W.
BG=33-50units DECEIVE¡; 25.Wash&Ream 30.5

CG = 48 - 50 units 26. Well Control

TG - O units 27. WOC 12.5

M FG = 0 units 28. Other 51.75
Total 24 1177.25

Total dours 24.0
CECIL,GM g 4

RIq Dcuntime Fuel Usage BulkMaterialon Board revious Cost $1,245.957

Daily 1.0 hrs Daily 504 Gals Cement: sx affy Cost $27,352
Cum. 38.3 hrs Cum. 34110 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost

PPI MSC Exploration 00MF\DENTIAL
i ,

E Daily Drilling Report
Block.Lease and WellNo. CdtitrkctRio 09.6 D.Eg Date on Location Snud Date Reoort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 52 51 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 17, 2004

g TV_Q Footaae AFg Nn AFEAmount Auth.TD Companv Representative

10,712 10,712 52 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Ooeration RigPhone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

TIH withnew bit RigFax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

CurrentWeather DÓNRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 18 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: U Yes U No g.§¾gtg Operator 5 9/7/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes j No Service 2 10/7/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT, SPËËD AND H3DRAUt CS kËCORD

BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

16 7 7/8" Hughes GX 20 5057252 14,14,15 10,296 412' 44 30 80 9.4 2 7
_

I

17 7 7/8" Reed HP 52 P70419 16,16,16 10,712

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

643 162 136 148

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV g SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

........ ....... ................ ...f.f.. ..
...

DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 5.5 2.64 85 224 2680 137 169 188 1/2 55 1220

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

LHe
gth: 463 6' Description: bit, bit sub(4.21), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241.20'), 1- 6.25" jars (36.22'), 6- 6.25" DC (177 44'), XO (2.88'), XO (1.25')

Smpi P.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

lË 11000 80 91 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2% KCL 145 145 24 John Umon M-I

#3 #4 DeslIt MudCI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONALSU IVEYS
145 255 24 4,212 $124,312

Ñ\b ÝVD ANGLE Direction Coordinates VS DL CLOSURE

10712 10712 4.00 °

OPERATONS SUllMARY

TI AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 1130 5.5 5 Drillto 10708' Tlme St mmary

1130 1230 1.0 17 Service rig Activity Daily Cum.

1230 1330 1.0 5 Drillto 10712' 1. Mob/DeMob 75

1330 1430 1.0 3 Circulate, Pump pilldrop survey 2. Cement 2.5

1430 2300 8.5 21 TOOH 3. Circulate 1 23

2300 0500 6.0 21 PU bit #17 &T1H 4. Ofrectional Work

0500 0600 1.0 15 Rig repair. Transmission filters 5. Drilling 6.5 643

6. Drive Plpe
7. Fishing 53

8. OHLogging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrlliCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; RID 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 1 47.25

Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 1 18

Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Plpe 0.5

Shinerump - 5060' Mownkopi- 5100' 20.ßurvey . 21

Moenkopi(Sinbad)6405' WhiteRim -7296° 21. Trips 14.5 164.25

22. Tst. BOPs 10
23. UR/HO

No new shows 24. W.O.W.
BG=33-50units DECEIVE¡; 25.Wash&Ream 30.5

CG = 48 - 50 units 26. Well Control

TG - O units 27. WOC 12.5

M FG = 0 units 28. Other 51.75

Total 24 1177.25

Total dours 24.0
CECIL,GM g 4

RIq Dcuntime Fuel Usage BulkMaterialon Board revious Cost $1,245.957

Daily 1.0 hrs Daily 504 Gals Cement: sx affy Cost $27,352
Cum. 38.3 hrs Cum. 34110 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block, Leage and WellNo, ContrpctRiq & B pate enLocatiçn Soud Date Repert Date
E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 51 50 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 16, 2004

TB Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representative

10,660 10.660 210 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Prêsent Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolgusher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No LC50 Sample Date Operator 1 9/7/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? Yes No Service 2 10/7/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth LinerTop MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 KS5 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H /DRAULICSRECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
16 7 7/8" Hughes GX 20 5057252 14,14,15 10,296' 364' 37 1/2 30 80 9.7

Bit Remprks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
636.6 162 136 148

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

pps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 5.5 3.64 85 224 2650 137 169 188 1/2 55 1220
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

LHe
gth: 463 6 Description: bit, bit sub(4.21), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241.20'), 1- 6.25" jars (36.22'), 6- 6.25" DC (177.44'), XO (2.88'), XO (1.25')

Smpl E.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PII 11000 80 103 120 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2% KCL 145 145 24 John Umon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost CumulativeCost
145 255 24 $2,929 $120,100

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE

OPERAT ONS SUt1MARY
Tii.dE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1300 7.0 5 Drillto 10517' Time St mmary
1300 1400 1.0 17 Service rig Activity Daily Cum.
1400 0600 16.0 5 Drillto 10660' 1. MoblDeMob 75

2. Cement 2.5
3. Circulate 22
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 23 636.5
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 46.25
Morrison -

2680* Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 1 17
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20.-Survey 21
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' 21. Trips 149.75

22. Tst. BOPs 10
23. UR/HO

No new shows 24. W.O.W.
BG = 17 - 50 units 25. Wash & Ream 30.5
CG = 43- 79 units 26. Well Control
TG - 0 units 27. WOC 12.5
M FG = 0 units 28. Other 51.75

Total 24 1153.25
Total iours 24.0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious Cost $1,225,414
Daily Daily 840 Gals Cement: sx allyCost $20.543
Cum. 37.3 hrs Cum. 33606 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost

PPI MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block, Leage and WellNo, ContrpctRiq & B pate enLocatiçn Soud Date Repert Date
E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 51 50 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 16, 2004

TB Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representative

10,660 10.660 210 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Prêsent Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolgusher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No LC50 Sample Date Operator 1 9/7/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? Yes No Service 2 10/7/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth LinerTop MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 KS5 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H /DRAULICSRECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
16 7 7/8" Hughes GX 20 5057252 14,14,15 10,296' 364' 37 1/2 30 80 9.7

Bit Remprks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
636.6 162 136 148

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

pps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 5.5 3.64 85 224 2650 137 169 188 1/2 55 1220
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

LHe
gth: 463 6 Description: bit, bit sub(4.21), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241.20'), 1- 6.25" jars (36.22'), 6- 6.25" DC (177.44'), XO (2.88'), XO (1.25')

Smpl E.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PII 11000 80 103 120 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2% KCL 145 145 24 John Umon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost CumulativeCost
145 255 24 $2,929 $120,100

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE

OPERAT ONS SUt1MARY
Tii.dE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1300 7.0 5 Drillto 10517' Time St mmary
1300 1400 1.0 17 Service rig Activity Daily Cum.
1400 0600 16.0 5 Drillto 10660' 1. MoblDeMob 75

2. Cement 2.5
3. Circulate 22
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 23 636.5
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 46.25
Morrison -

2680* Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 1 17
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20.-Survey 21
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' 21. Trips 149.75

22. Tst. BOPs 10
23. UR/HO

No new shows 24. W.O.W.
BG = 17 - 50 units 25. Wash & Ream 30.5
CG = 43- 79 units 26. Well Control
TG - 0 units 27. WOC 12.5
M FG = 0 units 28. Other 51.75

Total 24 1153.25
Total iours 24.0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious Cost $1,225,414
Daily Daily 840 Gals Cement: sx allyCost $20.543
Cum. 37.3 hrs Cum. 33606 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost



i ( , i
- 40NFilEN1lN

MPPI MSC Exploration '

ce DgilgOrilling igeport
Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract RIa Q.9,6 RFS Date on Location Saud Date Recort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 54 53 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 19, 2004

Ty Footaae AFENo. AFE Amqynt Auth. TD. Company Representative

10,997 10.997 122 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander
Present Ooeration RigPhone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

CurrentWeather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 18 Last BOP Test Date RIGELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No Operator 5 9/7/04 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass7 O Yes No Service 2 10/7/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth LinerTop MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35° 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 KSS STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED AND H *DRAULCS REC3RD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

17 7 7/8" Reed HP 52 P70419 16,16,16 10,712° 265' 38 30 80 7.0

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

663.b 166 140 161

Pump Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pum Pump #2 P_um

.. ...... . .......... . - .. .

DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 5.5 2.64 80 211 2840 98 189 98 1/2 52 1360

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

LHe
gth: 463.6' Description: bit, bit sub(4.21), 8-6 1/4" DC (241 20'), 1- 6.25" jars (36.22'), 6-8 25" DC (177.44'), XO (2.88'), XO (1.25')

Smpi F.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours MudEngineer Mud Company

11000 80 102 121 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2% KCL 145 145 24 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud Cl Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 255 24 51,999 $12f,42)

MD TVD

OPERAT ONS SUtlMARY
Tii4E Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0730 1.5 5 Drill to 10868' Time St mmary

0730 0800 0.5 17 Service rig Activity Daily Cum.

0800 1100 3.0 5 Drillto 10886' 1. Mob/DeMob 75

1100 1530 4.5 15 Rig repair. Pump #1 "O" ring 2. Cement 2.5

1530 1600 0.5 5 Drillto 10890' 3. Circulate 23

1600 1730 1.5 15 Rlg repair. Trip 5 stands. Repalr swivel 4. Directional Work

1730 0600 12.5 5 Drillto 10977' 5. Drilling 17.5 681
6. Drive Plpe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. Drill Cmt.lLOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 6 53.25

Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rlg 0.5 19

Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5

Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 21

Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' 21. Trips 167.25

22. Tst. BOPs 10

23. UR/HO

No new shows RECHVED 24. W.O.W.

M FG = 0 units 28. Other 51.75
DikUFUlk GAS Mig Total 24 1225.25

Total dours 24.0
Rig Dcuntime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $1,291,800

Daily 6.0 hrs Daily 840 Gals Cement: sx DailyCost $19,423
Cum. 44.3 hrs Cum. 35664 Gals Barlte: sx Cum. Cost

i ( , i
- 40NFilEN1lN

MPPI MSC Exploration '

ce DgilgOrilling igeport
Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract RIa Q.9,6 RFS Date on Location Saud Date Recort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union#7 54 53 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 19, 2004

Ty Footaae AFENo. AFE Amqynt Auth. TD. Company Representative

10,997 10.997 122 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander
Present Ooeration RigPhone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

CurrentWeather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 18 Last BOP Test Date RIGELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No Operator 5 9/7/04 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass7 O Yes No Service 2 10/7/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth LinerTop MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35° 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 KSS STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED AND H *DRAULCS REC3RD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

17 7 7/8" Reed HP 52 P70419 16,16,16 10,712° 265' 38 30 80 7.0

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

663.b 166 140 161

Pump Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pum Pump #2 P_um

.. ...... . .......... . - .. .

DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 5.5 2.64 80 211 2840 98 189 98 1/2 52 1360

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

LHe
gth: 463.6' Description: bit, bit sub(4.21), 8-6 1/4" DC (241 20'), 1- 6.25" jars (36.22'), 6-8 25" DC (177.44'), XO (2.88'), XO (1.25')

Smpi F.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours MudEngineer Mud Company

11000 80 102 121 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2% KCL 145 145 24 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud Cl Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 255 24 51,999 $12f,42)

MD TVD

OPERAT ONS SUtlMARY
Tii4E Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0730 1.5 5 Drill to 10868' Time St mmary

0730 0800 0.5 17 Service rig Activity Daily Cum.

0800 1100 3.0 5 Drillto 10886' 1. Mob/DeMob 75

1100 1530 4.5 15 Rig repair. Pump #1 "O" ring 2. Cement 2.5

1530 1600 0.5 5 Drillto 10890' 3. Circulate 23

1600 1730 1.5 15 Rlg repair. Trip 5 stands. Repalr swivel 4. Directional Work

1730 0600 12.5 5 Drillto 10977' 5. Drilling 17.5 681

6. Drive Plpe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. Drill Cmt.lLOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13

13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 6 53.25

Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rlg 0.5 19

Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5

Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 21

Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' 21. Trips 167.25

22. Tst. BOPs 10

23. UR/HO

No new shows RECHVED 24. W.O.W.

M FG = 0 units 28. Other 51.75
DikUFUlk GAS Mig Total 24 1225.25

Total dours 24.0
Rig Dcuntime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $1,291,800

Daily 6.0 hrs Daily 840 Gals Cement: sx DailyCost $19,423
Cum. 44.3 hrs Cum. 35664 Gals Barlte: sx Cum. Cost



PI MSC Exploration
,"" Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease ang WellNo. Contract Rio g QF§ Dpte on Locytion Saud Date Reoort Date
E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 53 52 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 18, 2004

i Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representative
10,855 10,855 143 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operatiça Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher
Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 18 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50 Sample Date Operator 5 9/7/04 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: O No Pass? O Yes No Service 2 10/7/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 Sl8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HYDRAUL CS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
17 7 7/8" Reed HP 52 P70419 16,16,16 10,712' 143' 20 1/2 30 60 7.0

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO At ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 5.5 2.64 94 248 2770 98 189 98 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 463.6' Description: bit, bit sub(4.21), 8-6 1/4" DC (241.20'), 1- 6.25" jars (36.22'), 6- 6.25" DC (177.44'), XO (2.88'),XO (1.25')

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT 9.1+ 53 22 20 11/17 7.6 2 5.75 0.33 13.5 9.5 0.3 .35/2.3

Smpi F.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PI 11000 80 104 |21 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2% KCL 145 145 12 John Limon M-1

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI DailyCost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 255 12 $1,116 $125,428

MD TVD ANGLE VS

JPERATI )NS SU¥MARY
¡AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0900 3.0 21 TIH with new bit Time St mmary
0900 2330 14.5 5 Drilling to 10805' Activity Daily Cum.
2330 0000 0.5 17 Service Rig 1. Mob/DeMob 75
0000 0600 6.0 5 Drillingto 10855' 2. Cement 2.5

3. Circulate 23
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 20.5 663.5
6. Drive Pipe

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 7. Fishing 53
Morrison -2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 8. OH Logging
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 9. Lost Circ.
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta -4098' 10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960 11. N.U./ N.D.
Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 12. P.U.lL.D. BHA 13
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' 13. P.U./L.D. Plpe

14. R/U; RID 2.5
15. Rig Repair 47.25

Show @ 10811'-10827', pale yellow cut 16. Run Casing 6.5
BG = 33-75 units 17. Service Rig 0.5 18.5
CG = 56-86 units 18. Sidetrack Op,
TG - 226 units 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
M FG = 0 units 20. Survey 21

21. Trips 3 167.25
22. Tst. BOPs 10
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream 30.5
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28,_Other 51.75

Total 24 1201.25Total -lours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulk Material on Board Previous Cost $1,273,309Daily Daily 714 Gals ement: sx DailyCost $16,491Cum. 38.3 hrs Cum. 34824 Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost

PI MSC Exploration
,"" Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease ang WellNo. Contract Rio g QF§ Dpte on Locytion Saud Date Reoort Date
E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 53 52 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 18, 2004

i Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representative
10,855 10,855 143 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operatiça Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher
Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 18 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50 Sample Date Operator 5 9/7/04 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: O No Pass? O Yes No Service 2 10/7/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 Sl8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HYDRAUL CS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
17 7 7/8" Reed HP 52 P70419 16,16,16 10,712' 143' 20 1/2 30 60 7.0

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO At ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 5.5 2.64 94 248 2770 98 189 98 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 463.6' Description: bit, bit sub(4.21), 8-6 1/4" DC (241.20'), 1- 6.25" jars (36.22'), 6- 6.25" DC (177.44'), XO (2.88'),XO (1.25')

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT 9.1+ 53 22 20 11/17 7.6 2 5.75 0.33 13.5 9.5 0.3 .35/2.3

Smpi F.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PI 11000 80 104 |21 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2% KCL 145 145 12 John Limon M-1

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI DailyCost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 255 12 $1,116 $125,428

MD TVD ANGLE VS

JPERATI )NS SU¥MARY
¡AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0900 3.0 21 TIH with new bit Time St mmary
0900 2330 14.5 5 Drilling to 10805' Activity Daily Cum.
2330 0000 0.5 17 Service Rig 1. Mob/DeMob 75
0000 0600 6.0 5 Drillingto 10855' 2. Cement 2.5

3. Circulate 23
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 20.5 663.5
6. Drive Pipe

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 7. Fishing 53
Morrison -2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 8. OH Logging
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 9. Lost Circ.
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta -4098' 10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960 11. N.U./ N.D.
Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 12. P.U.lL.D. BHA 13
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' 13. P.U./L.D. Plpe

14. R/U; RID 2.5
15. Rig Repair 47.25

Show @ 10811'-10827', pale yellow cut 16. Run Casing 6.5
BG = 33-75 units 17. Service Rig 0.5 18.5
CG = 56-86 units 18. Sidetrack Op,
TG - 226 units 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
M FG = 0 units 20. Survey 21

21. Trips 3 167.25
22. Tst. BOPs 10
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream 30.5
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28,_Other 51.75

Total 24 1201.25Total -lours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulk Material on Board Previous Cost $1,273,309Daily Daily 714 Gals ement: sx DailyCost $16,491Cum. 38.3 hrs Cum. 34824 Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost



1 I :PP
MSC Exploration

Daily Drilling Report
Block. Lease and WellNo. ObathhhRid 9.9..L D.Eg Date on Location SDud Date Reoort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 50 55 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 21, 2004

M Footaqq AFENo. AFEAmobnt Auth.T Company Representative
10,990 10,990 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operatien Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
TIH withbit Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 18 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: U Yes O No LC50 Sample Date Operator 5 9/7/04 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass7 U Yes U No Service 2 10/7/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing Str\ng OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Settinç Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H-DRAULCS REC3RD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

1/HR / //8" Reed HP 62 P/0419 open 10,990'
bit, bit sub(4.21), 8.

BitRemarks: cum.ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Tor ue
682

Pump Slow Punig Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 Pump #3

.. ..... -.-..--...........

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 5.5 2.64 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

LHe
gth: 463.6' Description: bit, bit sub(4.21), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241.20'), 1- 6.25" jars (36 22'), 6- 6.25" DC (177.44'), XO (2 88'), XO (1.25')

Smpi I-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

10000 80 BA #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2 % KCL 145 145 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Dally Cost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIONALSURVEYS
145 255 $)32 130,329

OPERAT ONS SUNMARY
TliAE Time Boats: . Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0530 23.5 8 Finish running AIT, Sonic, Density, Neutron, GR. Run standard dipmeter. Time St mmary
0530 0600 0.5 21 TIH In hole with bit. Activity Daily Cum.

1. Mob/DeMob 75
2. Cement 2.5
3. Circulate 29
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 682
6. Drlve Pipe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Lopping 23.5 30
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U.IL.D. Pipe
14. RIU; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 53.25

Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rip 19

Navojo - 3843' Kayente - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Winéate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5

Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 21

Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim -7296' 21. Trips 0.5 178.25
22. Tst. BOPs 10
23. UR/HO

Hi ElVED 24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream 30.5

28. Other 51.75

Total dours 24.0
DWUFOp pµ RMINING Total 24 1273.25

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulkMaterialon Board Previous Cost $1,330;124
Daily Daily 294 Gals ement: sx Daily Cost $73,137
Cum. 44.3 hrs Cum. 36336 Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost

1 I :PP
MSC Exploration

Daily Drilling Report
Block. Lease and WellNo. ObathhhRid 9.9..L D.Eg Date on Location SDud Date Reoort Date

E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC#35-1 Union #7 50 55 7/27/04 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 21, 2004

M Footaqq AFENo. AFEAmobnt Auth.T Company Representative
10,990 10,990 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operatien Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
TIH withbit Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 18 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: U Yes O No LC50 Sample Date Operator 5 9/7/04 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass7 U Yes U No Service 2 10/7/04 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing Str\ng OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Settinç Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H-DRAULCS REC3RD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

1/HR / //8" Reed HP 62 P/0419 open 10,990'
bit, bit sub(4.21), 8.

BitRemarks: cum.ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Tor ue
682

Pump Slow Punig Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 Pump #3

.. ..... -.-..--...........

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 5.5 2.64 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

LHe
gth: 463.6' Description: bit, bit sub(4.21), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241.20'), 1- 6.25" jars (36 22'), 6- 6.25" DC (177.44'), XO (2 88'), XO (1.25')

Smpi I-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

10000 80 BA #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2 % KCL 145 145 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Dally Cost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIONALSURVEYS
145 255 $)32 130,329

OPERAT ONS SUNMARY
TliAE Time Boats: . Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0530 23.5 8 Finish running AIT, Sonic, Density, Neutron, GR. Run standard dipmeter. Time St mmary
0530 0600 0.5 21 TIH In hole with bit. Activity Daily Cum.

1. Mob/DeMob 75
2. Cement 2.5
3. Circulate 29
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 682
6. Drlve Pipe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Lopping 23.5 30
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U.IL.D. Pipe
14. RIU; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 53.25

Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5

Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rip 19

Navojo - 3843' Kayente - 4098' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Winéate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5

Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 21

Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim -7296' 21. Trips 0.5 178.25
22. Tst. BOPs 10
23. UR/HO

Hi ElVED 24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream 30.5

28. Other 51.75

Total dours 24.0
DWUFOp pµ RMINING

Total 24 1273.25

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulkMaterialon Board Previous Cost $1,330;124
Daily Daily 294 Gals ement: sx Daily Cost $73,137
Cum. 44.3 hrs Cum. 36336 Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost



PI MSC Explorationuno ' Daily Drilling Report
Block, L90s9 and Well No. Contract Rig QQ.6 Qf.$ Date on Location Soud Date Renort Date

E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 55 54 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 20, 2004
M_D TV_D Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative

10,980 3 $627.000 8,500' Carl Hulslander
Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Logging Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 21 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: Yes No LC50Sample Date Operator 5 9/7/2004 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: No Pass? O Yes No Service 5 10/7/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HYDRAUL ICS RECORD
BIT BitType and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
17 7 7/8" Reed HP 52 P70419 16,16,16 10,712' 268' 39 30 80 6.9

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt RO I Wt Torque
682 16b 140 1b1

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pump #2 Pum #3

gps 1/4
1 9 x 5.5 2.64 80 211 2840 98 189 98 1/2 52 1360
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

L gth: 463.6' Description: bit, bit sub(4.21), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241 20'). 1- 6.25" jars (36.22'), 6- 6 25" DC (177 44'), XO (2.88'), XO (1.25')

Smpi 1-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PI i 10000 80 104 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2% KCL 145 145 Jon Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONALSURVEYS
145 255 5 Š2,60 $129,69)

MD TVD ANGLE CLOSURE
10980 4.00 °

OPERATONS SUNMARY
ME Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0700 1.0 5 Drillto 10980' TD Time SL mmary
0700 0900 2.0 3 Circulate and condition hole Activity Daily Cum.
0900 1030 1.5 21 Short trip, 15 stands. Hole clean no drag 1. Mob/DeMob 75
1030 1430 4.0 3 Circulate and condition hole for logs. Raise vis to 55 2. Cement 2.5
1430 2330 9.0 21 Pump pill, drop survey, TOOH. Slim line measurement 10990' 3. Circulate 6 29
2330 0600 6.5 8 RU Ioggers. Loggers totaldepth 10987'. Schlumberger 4. Directional Work

Running AIT, Sonic, Density, Neutron, GR 5. Drilling 1 682
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Logging 6.5 6.5
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. RIU; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 53.25
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 19
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. SidetrackOp.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 21
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' 21. Trips 10.5 177.75

22. Tst. BOPs 10
23. UR/HO

No new shows 24. W.O.W.
BG = 8 - 47 units 25. Wash & Ream 30.5
CG = 47 units 26. Well Control
TG - 0 units 27. WOC 12.5
M FG = 0 units 28. Other 51.75

Total 24 1249.25
Total lours 24.0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage BulkMaterial on Board revious Cost $1.311,223
Daily Daily 378 Gals Cement: sx ailyCost $18,901
Cum. 37.3 hrs Cum. 36042 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost

PI MSC Explorationuno ' Daily Drilling Report
Block, L90s9 and Well No. Contract Rig QQ.6 Qf.$ Date on Location Soud Date Renort Date

E Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union #7 55 54 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 20, 2004
M_D TV_D Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative

10,980 3 $627.000 8,500' Carl Hulslander
Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Logging Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 21 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: Yes No LC50Sample Date Operator 5 9/7/2004 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: No Pass? O Yes No Service 5 10/7/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HYDRAUL ICS RECORD
BIT BitType and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
17 7 7/8" Reed HP 52 P70419 16,16,16 10,712' 268' 39 30 80 6.9

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt RO I Wt Torque
682 16b 140 1b1

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pump #2 Pum #3

gps 1/4
1 9 x 5.5 2.64 80 211 2840 98 189 98 1/2 52 1360
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

L gth: 463.6' Description: bit, bit sub(4.21), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241 20'). 1- 6.25" jars (36.22'), 6- 6 25" DC (177 44'), XO (2.88'), XO (1.25')

Smpi 1-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PI i 10000 80 104 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2% KCL 145 145 Jon Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONALSURVEYS
145 255 5 Š2,60 $129,69)

MD TVD ANGLE CLOSURE
10980 4.00 °

OPERATONS SUNMARY
ME Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0700 1.0 5 Drillto 10980' TD Time SL mmary
0700 0900 2.0 3 Circulate and condition hole Activity Daily Cum.
0900 1030 1.5 21 Short trip, 15 stands. Hole clean no drag 1. Mob/DeMob 75
1030 1430 4.0 3 Circulate and condition hole for logs. Raise vis to 55 2. Cement 2.5
1430 2330 9.0 21 Pump pill, drop survey, TOOH. Slim line measurement 10990' 3. Circulate 6 29
2330 0600 6.5 8 RU Ioggers. Loggers totaldepth 10987'. Schlumberger 4. Directional Work

Running AIT, Sonic, Density, Neutron, GR 5. Drilling 1 682
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 53
8. OH Logging 6.5 6.5
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. RIU; R/D 2.5

Morrison Shale - 0' Dakota 2230' 15. Rig Repair 53.25
Morrison - 2680' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3140' 16. Run Casing 6.5
Entrada - 3263' Carmel - 3684' 17. Service Rig 19
Navojo - 3843' Kayenta - 4098' 18. SidetrackOp.
Wingate - 4375' Chinie - 4960' 19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
Shinarump - 5060' Mownkopi - 5100' 20. Survey 21
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6405' White Rim - 7296' 21. Trips 10.5 177.75

22. Tst. BOPs 10
23. UR/HO

No new shows 24. W.O.W.
BG = 8 - 47 units 25. Wash & Ream 30.5
CG = 47 units 26. Well Control
TG - 0 units 27. WOC 12.5
M FG = 0 units 28. Other 51.75

Total 24 1249.25
Total lours 24.0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage BulkMaterial on Board revious Cost $1.311,223
Daily Daily 378 Gals Cement: sx ailyCost $18,901
Cum. 37.3 hrs Cum. 36042 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost



010
MSC E loration

se ine Daily þri n Neport
Block.Lease andWellNo. Contract Ria 99.6 OEgl Date on Location Soud Date Report Date

E. Crested Juction WildcatWillš¾SC#5540 Unlon#7 57 56 7/27/2004 Ju! 28, 2004 Sep 22, 2004

MS Footage AFg No. AFE Amot,mt Auth. TO. Company Representative

10,990 10,990 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operatlen Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher

Circulate and ConditionMud Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

CurrentWeather DONRVIsit NPDES People on Loc.: 15 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: U Yes O No (9,5,,0Sain2[g Operator 2 9/7/2004 RKB 15 fl

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes No Service 2 10/7/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H/DRAUt CS RECORD

BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets D th in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

1/RR / //8" Heed HP b2 P/0419 open 10,990'

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

682

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed S_PM Pumg #2 Puy

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 5.5 2.64 80 211 2190 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

LHe
gth: 463.6' Description: bit, bit sub(4.21), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241.20'), 1- 6.25"jars (36.22'), 6- 6.25" DC (177.44'), XO (2.88'), XO (1.25')

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL% SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT 9.3 48 21 13 8/16 7.8 2 7 0.35 14 9.5 0.3 3/2

Smpi F.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

1 10000 80 86 #1 #2 Desand Cent.

2 % KCL 145 145 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt MudCI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONALSURVEYS
145 255 $322 $130,651

MD

OPERAT ONS SUllMARY
AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0730 1.5 17 Slip and cut 80' drilling line Time St mmary

0730 0800 0.5 17 Service rig Activity Daily Cum.

0800 1000 2.0 21 TIH 1. Mob/DeMob 75

1000 1030 0.5 3 Break circulation at 4152' 2. Cement 2.5

1030 1200 1.5 21 TIH 3. Circulate 4 33

1200 1230 0.5 3 Break circulation at 6864' 4. Directional Work

1230 1430 2.0 21 TlH RF(,HVED 5.Drilling 682

1430 1500 0.5 25 Wash and ream 64' to bottom 6. Drive Pipe

1500 1800 3.0 3 Circulate and condition hole. 7. Flshing 53

8. OH Logging 30
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3

11. N.U.I N.D.

Mud logger and Mud engineer released @0600 hrs 12. P.U.lL.D. BHA 13

GalanWilliams notified to run casing @1800 hrs 9/21/04 13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5
15. Rig Repair 53.25
16 un Casing 6.5

17. Service Rig 2 21
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Plpe 0.5
20. Survey 21

BG = 4 units 21. Trips 5.5 183.75

CG = 0 units 22. Tst. BOPs 10

TG - 208 units 23. UR/HO

MFG=310units «ECEIVED 24.w.ow.
25. Wash & Ream 0.5 31

DECI a g 26.w.ilcontroi
27. WOC 12.5

DalOF0 28. Other 51.75ILGiu a MWWQ Total 12 1285.25

Total dours 12.0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulkMaterial on Board revious Cost $1,403,261

Daily Daily 290 Gals ement: sx aily Cost $21,284

Cum. 44.3 hrs Cum. 36626 Gals arite: sx um. Cost

010
MSC E loration

se ine Daily þri n Neport
Block.Lease andWellNo. Contract Ria 99.6 OEgl Date on Location Soud Date Report Date

E. Crested Juction WildcatWillš¾SC#5540 Unlon#7 57 56 7/27/2004 Ju! 28, 2004 Sep 22, 2004

MS Footage AFg No. AFE Amot,mt Auth. TO. Company Representative

10,990 10,990 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operatlen Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher

Circulate and ConditionMud Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

CurrentWeather DONRVIsit NPDES People on Loc.: 15 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: U Yes O No (9,5,,0Sain2[g Operator 2 9/7/2004 RKB 15 fl

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes No Service 2 10/7/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H/DRAUt CS RECORD

BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets D th in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

1/RR / //8" Heed HP b2 P/0419 open 10,990'

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

682

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed S_PM Pumg #2 Puy

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 5.5 2.64 80 211 2190 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

LHe
gth: 463.6' Description: bit, bit sub(4.21), 8- 6 1/4" DC (241.20'), 1- 6.25"jars (36.22'), 6- 6.25" DC (177.44'), XO (2.88'), XO (1.25')

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL% SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT 9.3 48 21 13 8/16 7.8 2 7 0.35 14 9.5 0.3 3/2

Smpi F.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

1 10000 80 86 #1 #2 Desand Cent.

2 % KCL 145 145 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Desilt MudCI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONALSURVEYS
145 255 $322 $130,651

MD

OPERAT ONS SUllMARY
AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0730 1.5 17 Slip and cut 80' drilling line Time St mmary

0730 0800 0.5 17 Service rig Activity Daily Cum.

0800 1000 2.0 21 TIH 1. Mob/DeMob 75

1000 1030 0.5 3 Break circulation at 4152' 2. Cement 2.5

1030 1200 1.5 21 TIH 3. Circulate 4 33

1200 1230 0.5 3 Break circulation at 6864' 4. Directional Work

1230 1430 2.0 21 TlH RF(,HVED 5.Drilling 682

1430 1500 0.5 25 Wash and ream 64' to bottom 6. Drive Pipe

1500 1800 3.0 3 Circulate and condition hole. 7. Flshing 53

8. OH Logging 30
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3

11. N.U.I N.D.

Mud logger and Mud engineer released @0600 hrs 12. P.U.lL.D. BHA 13

GalanWilliams notified to run casing @1800 hrs 9/21/04 13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 2.5
15. Rig Repair 53.25
16 un Casing 6.5

17. Service Rig 2 21
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Plpe 0.5
20. Survey 21

BG = 4 units 21. Trips 5.5 183.75

CG = 0 units 22. Tst. BOPs 10

TG - 208 units 23. UR/HO

MFG=310units «ECEIVED 24.w.ow.
25. Wash & Ream 0.5 31

DECI a g 26.w.ilcontroi
27. WOC 12.5

DalOF0 28. Other 51.75ILGiu a MWWQ Total 12 1285.25

Total dours 12.0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulkMaterial on Board revious Cost $1,403,261

Daily Daily 290 Gals ement: sx aily Cost $21,284

Cum. 44.3 hrs Cum. 36626 Gals arite: sx um. Cost



MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block. Lease and Well Ng. Contract Ria 29.6 9.F.g Opte on Leêption S3ud Date Report Dête
E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union#7 57 56 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 22, 2004

M Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Compa iv Representative
10,990 10,990 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Prêsent Opergtion Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Tooloustier
Laying down BHA Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 15 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes i No LC50 Sample Date Operator 2 9/7/2004 RKB 15 11
Seas: Problem7 U Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass7 O Yes No Service 2 10/7/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 KSS STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H /DRAUL CS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

1/RR (//8 ReedHÑb2 Vf0419 open $0,990
Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

682
Pump Slow Pump PressuresNo. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 Pump #3

gps DC | DP 1/4
1 9 x 5.5 2.64 80 211 2190 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

L
nAgth:

463.6' Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT 9.3 48 21 13 8/16 7.8 2 7 0.35 14 9.5 0.3 .3/2

Smpi E.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PIT 10000 80 86 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2% KCL 145 145 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Deslit Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 255 564A $130,9/3

MD TVD ANGLE VS CLOSURE

( PERATIONS SUMMARY
DIE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status.

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0730 1.5 17 Slip and cut 80' drilling line Time SL mmary0730 0800 0.5 17 Service rig Activity Daily Cum.0800 1000 2.0 21 TlH 1. Mob/DeMob 751000 1030 0.5 3 Break circulation at 4152' 2. Cement 2.51030 1200 1.5 21 TlH 3. Circulate 6 351200 1230 0.5 3 Break circulation at 6864' 4. Directional Work
1230 1430 2.0 21 TIH 5. Drilling 6821430 1500 0.5 25 Wash and ream 64' to bottom 6. Drive Pipe1500 2000 5.0 3 Circulate and conditionhole. RUT&Mcasing crew LD machine 7. Fishing 532000 0600 10.0 21 TOOH laying down drill pipe and drill collars 8. OH Logging 30

9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U.I N.D.

Mud logger and Mud engineer released @0600 hrs 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
Galan Williams notified to run casing g 1800 hrs 9/21/04 13. P.U./L.D. Pipe

14. R/U; R/D 2.5
15. Rig Repair 53.25
16. Run Casing 6.5
17. Service Rig 2 21
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
20. Survey 21

BG = 4 units 21. Trips 15.5 193.75
CG = 0 units 22. Tst. BOPs 10TG - 208 units 23. UR/HO
M FG = 310 units 24. W.O.W.

25. Wash & Ream 0.5 31
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 51.75

Total 24 1297.25Total lours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuei Usage ulk Material on Board Previous Cost $1,403,261Daily Daily 580 Gals ement: sx Daily Cost $29,729Cum. 44.3 hrs Cum. 36916 Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost

MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block. Lease and Well Ng. Contract Ria 29.6 9.F.g Opte on Leêption S3ud Date Report Dête
E. Crested Juction Wildcat - State MSC #35-1 Union#7 57 56 7/27/2004 Jul 28, 2004 Sep 22, 2004

M Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Compa iv Representative
10,990 10,990 $827,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Prêsent Opergtion Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Tooloustier
Laying down BHA Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 15 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes i No LC50 Sample Date Operator 2 9/7/2004 RKB 15 11
Seas: Problem7 U Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass7 O Yes No Service 2 10/7/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7
Conductor 12 3/4" 24 LP Weld 2 35' 35' Air
Surface 8 5/8" 24 KSS STC 13 513' 513' 8.4

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H /DRAUL CS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

1/RR (//8 ReedHÑb2 Vf0419 open $0,990
Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

682
Pump Slow Pump PressuresNo. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 Pump #3

gps DC | DP 1/4
1 9 x 5.5 2.64 80 211 2190 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

L
nAgth:

463.6' Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT 9.3 48 21 13 8/16 7.8 2 7 0.35 14 9.5 0.3 .3/2

Smpi E.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PIT 10000 80 86 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2% KCL 145 145 John Limon M-I

#3 #4 Deslit Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
145 255 564A $130,9/3

MD TVD ANGLE VS CLOSURE

( PERATIONS SUMMARY
DIE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status.

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0730 1.5 17 Slip and cut 80' drilling line Time SL mmary0730 0800 0.5 17 Service rig Activity Daily Cum.0800 1000 2.0 21 TlH 1. Mob/DeMob 751000 1030 0.5 3 Break circulation at 4152' 2. Cement 2.51030 1200 1.5 21 TlH 3. Circulate 6 351200 1230 0.5 3 Break circulation at 6864' 4. Directional Work
1230 1430 2.0 21 TIH 5. Drilling 6821430 1500 0.5 25 Wash and ream 64' to bottom 6. Drive Pipe1500 2000 5.0 3 Circulate and conditionhole. RUT&Mcasing crew LD machine 7. Fishing 532000 0600 10.0 21 TOOH laying down drill pipe and drill collars 8. OH Logging 30

9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 3
11. N.U.I N.D.

Mud logger and Mud engineer released @0600 hrs 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 13
Galan Williams notified to run casing g 1800 hrs 9/21/04 13. P.U./L.D. Pipe

14. R/U; R/D 2.5
15. Rig Repair 53.25
16. Run Casing 6.5
17. Service Rig 2 21
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe 0.5
20. Survey 21

BG = 4 units 21. Trips 15.5 193.75
CG = 0 units 22. Tst. BOPs 10TG - 208 units 23. UR/HO
M FG = 310 units 24. W.O.W.

25. Wash & Ream 0.5 31
26. Well Control
27. WOC 12.5
28. Other 51.75

Total 24 1297.25Total lours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuei Usage ulk Material on Board Previous Cost $1,403,261Daily Daily 580 Gals ement: sx Daily Cost $29,729Cum. 44.3 hrs Cum. 36916 Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost
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· From: "Williams, Galan" <gwilliams@PPITech.net>
To: '"dustindoucet@utah.gov'" <dustindoucet@utah.gov> jj
Date: 1/18/2005 2:15:46 PM
Subject: FW: Fw: State MSC 35-1 Perforations

Dustin:

The first completion attempt will be in the Pennsylvanian section from 8940'
to 8954'. The second group is in the Cutler section from 7878 to 8996 and
7920 to 7930'. Below are the logged intervals from the well:

Mancos Shale - O' Dakota 2245'
Morrison - 2510' Curtis (Moab Tongue) - 3132'
Entrada - 3258' Carmel - 3675'
Navajo - 3836' Kayenta - 4260'
Wingate - 4557' Chinie - 4918'
Shinarump - 5412' Mownkopi - 5412'
Moenkopi (Sinbad) 6394' White Rim - 6874'
Cutler - 7441' Pennsylvanian - 8697'

If there are any other questions, please call me. Thanks.

Galan

J. Galan Williams, P. E.
Vice President and General Manager of Managed Risk
PPI Technology Services, L. P.
800 Gessner, Suite 900
Houston, TX 77024
Ph: 713-464-2200
Fax: 866-591-4997
mailto:gwilliams@ppitech.net
ChecR us out at www.ppitech.net

-----Original Message---
From: LYNN FAUST [mailto:Ifaust@mscexploration.com]
Sent: Tuesday, January 18, 2005 10:03 AM
To: james@jonesconsultants.com; Williams, Galan
Subject: Fw: Fw: State MSC 35-1 Perforations

PIs see the following

Lynn Faust
MSC Exploration, LP
16800 Imperial Valley Dr., Suite 380
Houston, TX 77060
(281) 931-8933
(281) 931-8655 (Fax)
Ifaust@mscexploration.com

--- Original Message ---

From: "Dustin Doucet"
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Dustin Doucet - FW: Fw: State MSC 35-1 Perforations Page 2

' To: <Ifaust@mscexploration.com>
nt ctueReday JanuaeryM1S23050 :e2r6o

a ions CONFIDENTIN.
> Lynn,

> This is somewhat what Iwas looking for, but it still lacks actual
> geologic description. I know you drilled this well to ~11,000'. I
> don't know what the geology below ~8000' is (you supplied formation tops
> to about thisdepth in your APD and daily reports). In short, what are
> the formation tops in thiswell and what formations do you plan to
> complete in. I thinkifyou add this info to your description of
> completion procedures that should do it. Let me know if you have any
> more questions. Thanks.

> Dustin

> >>> "LYNN FAUST" <lfaust@mscexploration.com> 1/14/2005 9:53:58 AM >>

»Isthis what you need on the 35-1?

> Lynn Faust
> MSC Exploration, LP
> 16800 Imperial Valley Dr., Suite 380
> Houston, TX 77060
> (281) 931-8933
> (281) 931-8655 (Fax)
> Ifaust@mscexploration.com

> --- Original Message ---

> From: "LARRY MOYER" <lrmoyer@bresnan.net

»To:"Galan Williams" <gwilliams@PPITech.net>; "Jim Jones"
> <james@jonesconsultants.com>; "Larry R. Moyer" <lrmoyer@bresnan.net>;

> "Lynn
> Faust" <lfaust@mscexploration.com

»Sent:Wednesday, January 12, 2005 6:01 PM
> Subject: State MSC 35-1 Perforations

> > Attached is a file with my recommendations for completing the
> captioned
> well.

> > Larry

CC: "'Ifaust@mscexploration.com'"
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MSC EXPLORATION, L.P.
16800 IMPERIAL VALLEY DRIVE, STE. 380

HOUSTON, TEXAS 77060
(PHONE) 281-931-8933 (FAX) 281-931-8655

FACSIMILE TRANSMITTAL SHEET

PAX NUMBER: TOTAL NO. OP PAGES INCLUDING COVElt

(80¶ 359-3940 2 + cover
PHONE NUMBER: SENDER'S REPERENCE NUMBER

RE: YOUR REPSRENCE NUMBER:

Sundry Notice:State MSC 35-1

0 URGENT 12ÍFOR REVIEW B PLEASE COMMENT O PLEASE REPLY O PLEASE EXECUTE

NOTES/COMMENTS:

Mr.Doucet,

Please fined the Sundry Notice you requested ...

Sincerely,

Lynn Faust
C.EA
MSC Explorations RECEIVED

JAN28 2005
DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINING
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Jan 28 05 03:12p MSC EXPLORATION, LP 281 931 8655 p.2

STATEOF UTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

012 DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5.1.EASEDESIGMBONAND ËIALNUMBER:

6. IF INDIAN,At.LØrfEE OR TRIBENAME
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N In

7. UNITdrCAAGREEMENTNAME;
Do not use thisfonn for proposals to dM imr weis, signi!IcanUydeepen existingwelkbelow ourrent bullonWlob depth, menbr plugged weils, orio

dd horlaonlai Islerais. Use APPUCATIONFOR PERMITTOCRIM.fann forauchproposals.

1. TYPEOF MELL -- 5. WE NAMEandNUMBER:

OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER Shake. ¶¾ 35 \
2. NAMEOF CPERATOft 9. API NUMBER:

3. ADDRESSOF OPERATO PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: COUNTY: A Ñ O

01AJOTR. SECTION,TOWNSHIP,RANGE,MERIDIAlt (4) STATE:
uTAH

n. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXESTO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPg OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O e- 0 DEEPEN REPERFORATECURRENTFORMATION

NOTICE OF INTENT
(Suomit in Dupacata) ALTERCAsmo O FRACW M SERACK TO REPAIRWE

--•••-- O CASINGREM WW CONSTRUCTLON TEMPORAROBANDON

O CHANGETO PRE US PWS OPERATOR Cm TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETm PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENTREPORT CHANGEWELLNAME O PLUGBACK O ===•Pos^'
(sutimitorighalFann only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTHESUM WATER SHUT OFF
Data ofwork compiegen:

O COMGLE PRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER

O CONVERTWE TYPE RECOMPLETE-OLFFERENTFORMATKM

12 DESCRIBEPROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS. Clearly show al per1Inantdetails including deles, depths, volurnes, etc

COFiMNTIO
Date:

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) ja ML TITLE

SIGNATURE ( ¢ 4 DATE

(TMs spaan serstatause only)
APPROVED BYTHE STATE

(st20ao) son neerse sida)

RAENCEIVOEæD

DIVOFOIL,GAS&
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Jan 28 05 03:12p MSC EMPLORATION, LP 281 931 8855 p.3

To: MSC Exploration L.P. / Jack Stanley, Tidewater / James S. Jones
.

From: Larry R. Moyer Consulting, LLC / Larry R. Moyer p g|
Re: MSC Exploration L.P., State MSC 35-1 Completionand Perforation 1 lU 1i

Recommendations Summary
Date: January 12, 2005

After a review of petrophysicalinterpretations by Schlumberger,NuTech, Halliburton,
and those of my own, along with a review of the mudlog and the well cuttings samples,
the following is a summary of my recommendations for the completion of the captioned
well.

The recommendations are influenced by the consideration of properties for which very
limited or no data exists. In particular, the reservoir pressute and permeability are very
poorly defined. I believe the lack of reference data for fracture treatments in comparable
zones necessitates collection of information from Pump-in Injection Tests. I believe that
the lithologies and rock properties of the different zones are significantly different and
must be evaluated independently.

Zone 1 - 8,940' to 8,954'
a) Perform a pump-in test.
b) If the test shows that it is possible to fracture treat the zone, then perforate it at the

recommended interval.
c) Swab the zone to determine if hydrocarbons are present and worthy of a fracture

treatment
d) Fracture treat the zone in accordance with a designbased on the pump-in test.

Zone 2 - 7,876' to 7,890' and 7,920' to 7,932'
a) Complete as above.

Zone 3 - 7,494' to 7,670'
a) Complete as above, with selective perforating to omit tighter zones if the fracture

treatmentdesign indicates that it is appropriate.

Zone 4 -- 7,448' to 7,488'
a) Complete as above. This zone is believedto be sufficiently different to warrant

separate treatment.

Pending the results of the above program, or a completion program in the Federal MSC
26-1 well, the zone at 7,291' to 7,338' may also be a candidate.

Please contact me if you desire additional details or the reasoning behind the
recommendations above.

RECEIVED
JAN28 2005

DIVOFOIL,GAS&
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5 LEASE DESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

6 IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOT1CESAND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:

Do not use this fann for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below cunentbotlom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for sucti pmposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL OR WILDCAT:

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DE / COUNTY:

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: $$ STATE:
UTAH

9t CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICEOF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Appmximate date work willN CASING REPAIR O NEW CONSTRUCTION O TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE O TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT Q CHANGEWELLNAME O PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL

(Submit Original Form Only)
O CHANGEWELLSTATUS O PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) O WATERSHUT-OFF

Date ofwork completion:
O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: ‡ () ...-

O CONVERTWELLTYPE O RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

RECEIVED
JAN3 12005

DIVOFOIL,GA3

SIGNATURF ¿ 4 DATE

(This space for Slale use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse
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To: MSC Explorati .P. / Jack Stanley, Tidewater / James Jones
From: Larry R. Moyer Consulting, LLC / Larry R. Moyer
Re: MSC Exploration L.P., State MSC 35-1 Completion and Perforation

Recommendations Summary
Date: January 12, 2005

After a review of petrophysical interpretations by Schlumberger, NuTech, Halliburton,
and those of my own, along with a review of the mudlog and the well cuttings samples,
the following is a summary of my recommendations for the completion of the captioned
well.

The recommendations are influenced by the consideration of properties for which very
limited or no data exists. In particular, the reservoir pressure and permeability are very
poorly defined. I believe the lack of reference data for fracture treatments in comparable
zones necessitates collection of information from Pump-in Injection Tests. I believe that
the lithologies and rock properties of the different zones are significantly different and
must be evaluated independently.

Zone 1 - 8,940' to 8,954'
a) Perform a pump-in test.
b) If the test shows that it is possible to fracture treat the zone, then perforate it at the

recommended interval.
c) Swab the zone to determine if hydrocarbons are present and worthy of a fracture

treatment
d) Fracture treat the zone in accordance with a design based on the pump-in test.

Zone 2 - 7,876' to 7,890' and 7,920' to 7,932'
a) Complete as above.

Zone 3 - 7,494' to 7,670'
a) Complete as above, with selective perforating to omit tighter zones if the fracture

treatment design indicates that it is appropriate.

Zone 4 - 7,448' to 7,488'
a) Complete as above. This zone is believed to be sufficiently different to warrant

separate treatment.

Pending the results of the above program, or a completion program in the Federal MSC
26-1 well, the zone at 7,291' to 7,338' may also be a candidate.

Please contact me if you desire additional details or the reasoning behind the
recommendations
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Re: MSC Exploration L.P., State MSC 35-1 Completion and Perforation

Recommendations Summary
Date: January 12, 2005

After a review of petrophysical interpretations by Schlumberger, NuTech, Halliburton,
and those of my own, along with a review of the mudlog and the well cuttings samples,
the following is a summary of my recommendations for the completion of the captioned
well.

The recommendations are influenced by the consideration of properties for which very
limited or no data exists. In particular, the reservoir pressure and permeability are very
poorly defined. I believe the lack of reference data for fracture treatments in comparable
zones necessitates collection of information from Pump-in Injection Tests. I believe that
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NOTICE

Utah Oiland Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-21 states that,

> A well is considered completed when the well has been adequately worked to be capable
of producing oil or gas or when well testing as required by the division is concluded.

* Within 30 days after the completionor plugging of a well, the followingshall be filed:
• Form 8, Well Completion or Recompletion Report and Log
• A copy of electric and radioactivity logs, if run
• A copy of drillstem test reports,
• A copyof formation water analyses, porosity, permeability or fluid saturation

determinations
• A copy of core analyses, and lithologic logs or sample descriptions if compiled
• A copy of directional, deviation, and/or measurement-while-drilling survey for

each horizontal well

Failure to submit reports in a timelymanner willresult in the issuance of a Notice of Violation
by the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, and may result in the Division pursuing enforcement
action as outlined in Rule R649-10, Administrative Procedures, and Section 40-6-11 of the
Utah Code.

As of the mailing of this notice, the division has not received the required reports for

Operator: MSC EXPLORATION LP Today's Date: 08/02/2005

Well: API Number: Drilling Commenced:

SEE ATTACHEDLIST:

No monthly drilling reports since 12/2004

To avoidcompliance action, required reports should be mailed within 7 business days to:
Utah Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Ifyou have questions or concerns regarding this matter, please call (801) 538-5284.

cc: Well File
Compliance
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Location API Spud Spud Lease
Operator Twp-Rng-Sec Well Name Number Date - Dry Date - Rotary Type

MSC EXPLORATION,LP 2108 200E 16 STATE MSC 16-1 4301931401 05/14/04 05/17/04 State
MSC EXPLORATION,LP 2108 190E 35 STATE MSC 35-1 4301931404 07/27/04 State
MSC EXPLORATION,LP 2108 180E 02 CACTUS ROSE MSC 2-1 4301931402 09/09/04 State
MSC EXPLORATION,LP 210S 200E 02 N THOMPSON 2-1 4301931412 10/29/04 State
MSC EXPLORATION,LP 2108 190E 26 FEDERAL MSC 26-1 4301931407 11/08/04 11/12/04 Federal
NO WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG RECEIVED FOR THE FEDERAL MSC
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MSC EXPLORATION,LP 210S 200E 02 N THOMPSON 2-1 4301931412 10/29/04 State
MSC EXPLORATION,LP 2108 190E 26 FEDERAL MSC 26-1 4301931407 11/08/04 11/12/04 Federal
NO WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG RECEIVED FOR THE FEDERAL MSC



llENllAL
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMEMTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OtL GASAND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRISENAME:

Do notuse this fonn for pmposals to ddlinew wels, ilicanly deepen exialingwells belowcrurent bolimmaale depih, reenler plugged mois, or a
7. UNITorCAAGREEMENTNAME

dril hodzantal laterale. Use APPUCATIONFOR PERMrTTO DRK.Liorm r suchproposais.

1. TYPEOFWELL 6. WELLNAMEandNUMBER:

OIL WELL GASWELL OTHER

2. NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9. APINUMBER:

3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONENUMBER 10. FIELDANDPOOL,OR WILDCAT:

4 LOCATIONOFWELL

FooTAGESATsuRFACE: 410 Fuk.. C.. COUNTY:

QTRKITR, SECT10N,TOWNSH1P. RANGE. MERIDIAN \$ | $ $ STATE
UTAH

n. CHECKAPPROPRIATE BOXESTO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPEOFACTION

NOTICEOF INTENT
ACIDE DEEPEN REPERFORATECURRENT FORMATION

O ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

AppmmeMS*** CASINGREPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORMLYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUSPUNS O OPERATORCHANGE TUDINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PUJG ANDABANDON VENT OAFLARE

O SUBSEQUENTREPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUGBACK WATERMm
(SubmitOrigindFormO ) O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTARESUME> O WATERSHUT-OFF

Dale at womcompistion
O COMMINGLEPRODUCWGFOWO RECtAMAT10N OF WEt.LSITE OTIER

O CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE- DIFFERENT FORMATION

11 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS. Clearlyshow all pertinentdetaila includingdates, depths, volumes, etc

RECEIVEDREQUESTDENIED
Utah Divisionof SEP3 0 2005Off,Gas and M'

Date. - DN.0FOIL,GAS&MININGsy
coñaamoommo2

TrTLENAME (PLEASEPRINT) in A

SIGNATURE DATE

ome....•mrsI.i.·••••mo

(22000) (See Insinagone on Reverse
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CONFlDENTIAL
STATE OF UTAH AMENDED RE.PORT FORM S

DEPARTMENTOF NAYURALREGOURCES (highligh.ges)
DIVISION OF OIL, GASAND MlNING s. i,aase:ssonarmanosana mmeen-

Im - 9 N'7le
6. W:NCIA14.AILOFTEROR"'RBENAM

WELL COMPLETIONOR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG p p
ros::wwen 7 u TucAmt un«

ed

Î$40)tK"JW
O í??' O "äsarO RILO o i n -l

2. MATJEOMPt.RATOR S A i FRJf.706%

a Aconoss oronanAton
'~tc h$ 7) PHONE NUMSÊR: le LI$LD AND POOL CR WL CAT

i. LOCAliCNCFVeit.L IF TAGgg) 19, SECTION, TOWt.SHIP. RMlüt,

'* 41o T-N.L- + 43o Ecol - (0 Wat035 als de 5
ATTOPPRODUCitiGir:TEftVALREPORT£DGELOR

12. COUNTY 13. OTATE
Av verst omt! UTAH

la DATELPUDDEO. 12.DATET.D.REACHED. 18 DAltCOMP1.ETED 17. f.6VATONSfDF.BKð.itt.O'à
8-7-04- 9-/7-of

,,7
43- """°-=-0 y

in TCfALCEPTR MD () É 19,ÞU,iCBACKT.D,:MO ¿jgf.. C. FMULTIPLECO!.19tBTlÔNA.HÒWMAh.Yt* 21.0EfWilAIDGE MC
PI.UGSET

v= io 4,4c no g 44-7 Â no
µ?GE CTRICAteDOTH MICHMIICALLOGSRUP scoproleacn! 21

WASWEu.CORECT NO YM (Smu man
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71. thtitAL PRODucriou 1NTERVALA (As ahome in item 925)

DAT1!RitsT PRODL.CED TEST DATE. 8 TESil!D: TESTPRODUCTION CIL - BOL: GAS - MCP: WATER-DBU I¾D..vgTMOD
RATES: -•

CRORiscE; TEG %£55. CsG PRE$$ APIG U-IMS GASOLRAIKI 24tiftPRocucti0N CIL-00L GAC •MCF: R--MBL: INTEMMt.STATU5
RATES -•

W1ERVAt.B IAs ibouwt la!!ans att)

DATCFiltsfritoDUCED. TE$TCA70: MOuñ51T:STED. TESTPRODUCT.'ON 010-000 GAS-MCF; WAT€R-0BL PROD,l.tETilOD
RATES: *

CHCKE¾ti'E faG.PRESS CSG PRESS. APGitpATV stu-GAS QA:OLMATIO 24HitPRODUC110N DIL-SSt. GAS-MCV: WATER-BBC INTERVALTATO
RATES -

INTERvaL C gasthen in itern 924

DATEftRSTWRODUCED :ESTDATE: NOURBTEST40 TESTPROCMOTIOri O!L-SIII.: GAS-MCT: WATER-Obt PROD,AaCTNOC
WATES -*

CitCKE¾I25. TEG PA'553. CSG PRESS APIGR^VITY BTU-CA£ GASlolLitAllO adHNPROC4K"ilcN Ott-BDL GAS-MCF: WATER-ESL INTERVALSTATU3
RATES -

1NimVM. 9 (4p show in Itam $2t}

DisfiBRSirROCUCED TESIDATE: NCURSiestEtr TESTPRCOJCTiON CII.-BAI; -MCP WATEA-Gal. PRODMETHCO:
RATES -

CliCKEST f¾ßg&. CSGPPESS, ARGAAVifY li?U-GAS GASICILRATIC24NRPROGUCT10•t 01L-OUL CAS MCE: WATER-SBL INTEI lALSTATUS
PATE$ --

32. 3lšPO5r104 05 GAS(Sold,ti:ed for Fool, vaster,Etc)

31 SUrMtARYOF POA0ttS20NES OncludeAqaness} 34. PORMA110NILoc) MARitEAE:

Snee .e mpartant zonaso*pinonlyacd <menvs swed Coredinlonein and<B &lI•sism imis, aunt¾ 4tgih kgend

touted, mis>±runed, estetsetopen ilsmog andersehr pesantes andrecenam=s.

Femnitos essenytions.Conants,die Name (Maasure Ospily)

by curt fy thetthe f 60 and «Etash d onnedents so plek and coneet as detetualeed from allava3eMe maards.

Tisis repoit :nust tiosubmitted within 30 days of
• colnpletingor plugginga slewwel! · reeniedng a previouslyplugged and abandoned weTI
• driling horizontatlaterals froman existingwenbare • signiticantlydeepenin0 an existing wenbore below the previous bottom-hole depth
• recompicting la a differeniproducing formation • drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes. suchas core samples and stratigraphic tests

' OEM 40; Sliowhe numoer oicompleketts if producilan is measured separatelyfrom twoor more formalloris.

" iTEM& Cement Top-show trowreposted inp(s) ofcomerdwere determined (circulated(CHI).calculated (CAL},comani bond log (CBL},temperaturesurvey (FS))

Send to Utah Divisionof OII. Gas and Mining Phone: 801-530-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box145001 Fax: 801369-3940 RECEIVEDSalt Lake City,Uigh 34114-56G1

unoce, DEC122005
DNOF01L
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 8
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES (highlght changes)

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5 LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:
ML-47576

WELL COMPLETIONOR RECOMPLET10N REPORT AND LOG
6 IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

la. TYPE OF WE
LL WE L DRY OTHER

7 UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF WORK 8 WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

ZL
Z EP I

S OTHER State MSC 35-1
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9 API NUMBER:

MSC Exploration 4301931404
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT

1645 Court PI. #300 avv Denver STATE CO ze 80202 (303) 468-0656 WILDCAT
4 LOCATIONOF WELL(FOOTAGES) 11. QTRIQTRNSECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

ATSURFACE: 470 FNL& 1320 FWL
MERIDIA :

NWNW 35 21S 19E
ATTOP PRODUCING INTERVALREPORTED BELOw 470 FNL & 1320 FWL

12. COUNTY 13. STATE
..... . , ou ,..............."' "'- GRAND UTAH

14. DATESPUDDED: 15. DATET.D REACHED: 16 DATECOMPLETED: 17 ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL):

7/28/2004 9/19/2004 ABANDONED READYTO PRODUCE 15' RKB
18. TOTALDEPTH: MD 19. PLUG BACKT.D.: MD 8.067 20. IF MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS, HOW MANY?* 21 DE IDGE MD 8,067

TVD 4 TVD g-gg d TVD 8,067
22. TYPE ELECTRICANDOTHER MECHANICALLOGS RUN (Submit copyof each) 23

WAS WELL CORED? NO YES (S mitanal )
AIT,Sonic, Density, Neutron, GR &SP

WAS DST RUNT NO YES (S mm)
DIRECTIONALSURVEY? NO YES (Submit copy)

24. CASING AND L.INERRECORD (Report aH strings set in well)

HOLE SIZE SIZEIGRADE WEIGHT (#llt) TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) STAGE CEMHENTER C ENFMCPES
VO BL) CEMENT TOP ** AMOUNTPULLED

16 12 % LP 24 0 35 surf
12 8 5/8 K55 24 O 513 A 328 68 surf 10000

7 7/8 5 1/2 LSO 17 0 10,980 4,494 G 2,543 433 150000

25. TUBINGRECORD

SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

2 7/8 1,170
m PRODUCINGINTERVALS 27. Sm=*=-

FORMATIONNAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM(TVD) INTERVAL(TopfBot - MD) SIZE NO.HOLES PERFORATION STATUS

(^) Cutler 6,350 6,350 8.966 .5 8 OP•n O Squed

(B) Cutler 6,350 6,350 8,940 8,954 .43 42 on•n O Squed

(c) Cutler 6,350 6,350 7,920 7,932 .43 39 op•nO Squed

(D) Cutler 6,350 6,350 7,878 7,890 .43 36 op•n O Squod

28. ACID, FRACTURE, 1REATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNTANDTYPE OF MATERIAL

8640' - 8954' 500 gal 15% HCL acid
7920'-7890' 11.8 bbis 15% HCL acid & 12 bbis 15% HCLacid

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 3ik WELL STATUS:

ELECTRICAUMECHANICALLOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT O DST REPORT DIRECTlONALSURVEY TEMP SI
O SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGINGANDCEMENT VERIFICATION O CORE ANALYSIS OTHER:

(5/2000) (CONTINUEDON BACK)

MAYO1

STATE OF UTAH FORM 8
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES (highlght changes)

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5 LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:
ML-47576

WELL COMPLETIONOR RECOMPLET10N REPORT AND LOG
6 IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

la. TYPE OF WE
LL WE L DRY OTHER

7 UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF WORK 8 WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

ZL
Z EP I

S OTHER State MSC 35-1
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9 API NUMBER:
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1645 Court PI. #300 avv Denver STATE CO ze 80202 (303) 468-0656 WILDCAT
4 LOCATIONOF WELL(FOOTAGES) 11. QTRIQTRNSECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

ATSURFACE: 470 FNL& 1320 FWL
MERIDIA :

NWNW 35 21S 19E
ATTOP PRODUCING INTERVALREPORTED BELOw 470 FNL & 1320 FWL

12. COUNTY 13. STATE
..... . , ou ,..............."' "'- GRAND UTAH

14. DATESPUDDED: 15. DATET.D REACHED: 16 DATECOMPLETED: 17 ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL):

7/28/2004 9/19/2004 ABANDONED READYTO PRODUCE 15' RKB
18. TOTALDEPTH: MD 19. PLUG BACKT.D.: MD 8.067 20. IF MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS, HOW MANY?* 21 DE IDGE MD 8,067

TVD 4 TVD g-gg d TVD 8,067
22. TYPE ELECTRICANDOTHER MECHANICALLOGS RUN (Submit copyof each) 23

WAS WELL CORED? NO YES (S mitanal )
AIT,Sonic, Density, Neutron, GR &SP

WAS DST RUNT NO YES (S mm)

DIRECTIONALSURVEY? NO YES (Submit copy)

24. CASING AND L.INERRECORD (Report aH strings set in well)

HOLE SIZE SIZEIGRADE WEIGHT (#llt) TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) STAGE CEMHENTER C ENFMCPES
VO BL) CEMENT TOP ** AMOUNTPULLED
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7 7/8 5 1/2 LSO 17 0 10,980 4,494 G 2,543 433 150000
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O SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGINGANDCEMENT VERIFICATION O CORE ANALYSIS OTHER:

(5/2000) (CONTINUEDON BACK)

MAYO1



31. INI11ALPRODUC110N INTERVALA (As shown In item $20)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: -+

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. IGRAVITY BTU-GAS GASCIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBC GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

INTERVALB (As shown in Item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: -•

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. PI GRAVITY BTU - GAS GASCIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: ->

INTERVALC (As shown in Ilem #20)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES:

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG.PRESS. I GRAVITY BTU - GAS GASOIL RATIO24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

INTERVALD (As shown in Item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: -+

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. I GRAVITY BTU - GAS GASIOILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

32. DISPOSIT10N OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

33. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES (include Aquilers): 34. FORMAT10N(Log) MARKERS:

Show allimportant zones ofporosity and contentsthereof Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, induding depth interval
tested,cushionused, timetoolopen,flowingand shut-inpressures and recoveries.

Formation Descriptions, Contents, etc Name (Measu Depth)

Dakota SS 2.230
Curtis 3.080
Carmel 3.580

Navaio 3.710
Wingate 4,310
Chinie 4,710
Cutler 6,350

36. ADDITIONALREMARKt (Include plugg ogproceduse)

Well temporarilySI waiting on completion. RKB@8964', 8700', 8097'

36. I hereby certifythat the foregoing and attached inforrnation is complete and correct as determined from an availablerecords.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) R.E. Knight TITLE Agent

SIGNATURE DATE 4/10/2006
/

This report must be submitted wit 30 days of
• completing or plugging a new well e reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
• drillinghorizontal laterals from an existingwellbore e significantlydeepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
e recompleting to a different producing formation e drillinghydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM20: Show the numberof completionsif production is measured separately from twoor more formations.

**fTEM24: Cement Top-Show how reported top(s)ofcementwere determined (circulated (CIR),calculated(CAL),cement bond log (CBL),temperaturesurvey (TS)).

Send to: Utah Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801
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State MSC 35-1
API # 4301931404

Formation Depth, top Perforation Size No. Status Treatment
Interval Holes

Cutler 6350' 7448' - 7488 .43 120 open 13 bbls 10% Acetic
Acid

Chinle 4710' 5594' - 5590' .5 20 39 sx cmt SQUEEZE
5289' - 5287' .5 8 23 sx SQUEEZE

Chinle 4710' 5510' - 5503' .43 28 400 gals Xylene,
5477' - 5460 .43 68 400 gals Mod acid 101

5444' - 5426' .43 72 open
Chinle 4710' 5290' - 5322' .42 96 400 gals Xylene,

m' -5112'

.42 66 700 gals Mod acid
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API # 4301931404

Formation Depth, top Perforation Size No. Status Treatment
Interval Holes
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5289' - 5287' .5 8 23 sx SQUEEZE

Chinle 4710' 5510' - 5503' .43 28 400 gals Xylene,
5477' - 5460 .43 68 400 gals Mod acid 101

5444' - 5426' .43 72 open
Chinle 4710' 5290' - 5322' .42 96 400 gals Xylene,

m' -5112'

.42 66 700 gals Mod acid



MAXIS I iald I og

Index:10966.0- 555.0FT
MSC 35-I 3 yg

ooc

.coto Ior
Z'

I

ooe

O.

lii i., ill|=ll

-500 -300 -100 100 300 500
. . . .

EastDeparture

MAXIS I iald I og

Index:10966.0- 555.0FT
MSC 35-I 3 yg

ooc

.coto Ior
Z'

I

ooe

O.

lii i., ill|=ll

-500 -300 -100 100 300 500
. . . .

EastDeparture



TRU EVE'4T CA. ')!=TB vs. EAS"

MAXIS I laid I og

Index:10966.0- 555.0FT y j
MSC 3 F/ 2 2/3/¡fiE

I

Co

.c-Q
-co
C1.4

so--

cti

I

CO
CD

C\l
I i I I I

-500 -300
-100 100 300 500
FastDena

TRU EVE'4T CA. ')!=TB vs. EAS"

MAXIS I laid I og

Index:10966.0- 555.0FT y j
MSC 3 F/ 2 2/3/¡fiE

I

Co

.c-Q
-co
C1.4

so--

cti

I

CO
CD

C\l
I i I I I

-500 -300
-100 100 300 500
FastDena



illillai ii¡

-500 -300 100 100 300 500
. EastDeparture(F)•: a • • - . :. - es -

TRUEVERT CAL Di?"ivs.hORT I

Index:10966.0- 555.0FT 75~
2ty /ff

O :

r-Q
NCO
Q.4
CD

cc
. I

>o°
c\l

I--

I

o

C\l

-500 -300 -100 100 300 500
Alm.. n---..L.. -

illillai ii¡

-500 -300 100 100 300 500
. EastDeparture(F)•: a • • - . :. - es -

TRUEVERT CAL Di?"ivs.hORT I

Index:10966.0- 555.0FT 75~
2ty /ff

O :

r-Q
NCO
Q.4
CD

cc
. I

>o°
c\l

I--

I

o

C\l

-500 -300 -100 100 300 500
Alm.. n---..L.. -



State MSC 35-1
API # 4301931404
Spud date 7/28/04

Depth survey
528 2.75
710 2.25
801 2.75
861 3.5
1075 3.00
1655 3.25
2159 3.00
2609 3.00
3064 3.5
3544 3.00
4027 4.00
4284 4.0
4552 4.0
4853 4.5
5097 3.75
5187 4.0
5315 4.0
5407 3.75
5618 3.25
5803 2.75
5989 2.75
6208 3.00
6424 3.00
6608 5
6690 5.25
6790 5.0
6950 4.75
7150 5.00
7288 4.00
8123 4.00
8808 4.25
9330 4.0
9930 3.50
10712
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DEFAUtT FMI 010PUP FN:2 PRODUCER 28-Sep-2004 15:20

DEPT DEVI HAZI TVDE ND ED

600.0 3.1299 197.7151 600.0037 -0.0005 0.0046

700.0 3.1634 190.8531 699.8636 -5.1906
-1.0225

800.0 3.6848 193.5769 799.6820 -11.0726
-2.2828

900.0 4.3823 195.4302 899.4331 -17.8630
-4.1376

1000.0 4.2142 195.1726 999.1563 -25.0247
-6.1371

1100.0 3.9202 191.7661 1098.9033 -31.9419
-7.7610

1200.0 3.8218 194.1021 1198.6881 -38.3328
-9.2175

1300.0 3.8146 194.5051 1298.4615 -44.8346
-10.9435

1400.0 4.0869 196.1873 1398.2245 -51.4595
-12.7949

1500.0 4.1223 196.3067 1497.9675 -58.3346
-14.8107

1600.0 4.1311 196.2264 1597.7042 -65.2920
-16.8552

1700.0 4.1516 196.7952 1697.4487 -72.1439
-18.8757

1800.0 4.4166 199.2609 1797.1641 -79.3172
-21.1934

1900.0 4.3501 200.5469 1896.8656 -86.5618
-23.8534

2000.0 3.6121 206.7499 1996.6152 -92.8696
-27.0020

2100.0 3.8786 208.7660 2096.3987 -98.7268
-29.9877

2200.0 3.9444 203.8474 2196.1660 -104.7785

-33.1199

2300.0 3.8786 198.2032 2295.9268 -111.2090
-35.6456

2400.0 3.8353 199.9557 2395,6985 -111.5040

-38.0763

2500.0 3.6492 195.4506 2495.4932 -123.5186
-40.2705

2600.0 3.1499 204.3006 2595.3225 -128.9039
-42.4858

2700.0 3.1494 200.6997 2695.1804 -133.9429
-44.2125

2800.0 2.6182 210.6241 2795.0681 -138.1491
-46.3294

2900.0 2.8248 210.2111 2894.9604 -142.0654
-48.7890

3000.0 2.8242 209.3570 2994.8372 -146.2306
-51.4777

3100.0 3.2740 212.9122 3094.6814 -151.0415
-54.2932

3200.0 3.3586 205.4723 3194.5168 -155.9957
-57.1630

3300.0 3.5453 210.0039 3294.3279 -161.4050
-60.0698

3400.0 3.128T 208.2523 3394.1597 -166.3131
-63.1359

3500.0 3.3874 204.3307 3493.9968 -171.4495
-65.6133

3600 0 3.6723 204.7313 3593.7991 -177.1664
-68.2178

3700.0 4.3503 206.5786 3693.5417 -183.6942
-71.1485

3800.0 4.5258 206.1348 3793.2383 -190.6589
-74.6233

3900.0 4.4476 203.7628 3892.9341 -197.7381
-77.8826

4000.0 4.7427 201.7544 3992.6062 -205.1465
-81.1272

4100.0 4.6206 199.0580 4092.2847 -212.7189
-83.7387

4200.0 4.7071 194.8501 4191.9727 -220.2814
-85.9870

4300.0 5.1619 199.8791 4291.5771 -228.7220
-88.7319

4400.0 4.9894 199.9654 4391.1826 -237.0342
-91.8272

4500.0 4.9143 195.7485 4490.8159 -245.2115
-94.3429

4600.0 5.0369 197.1299 4590.4478 -253.4228
-96.8022

4700.0 5.0118 196.4477 4690.0649 -261.7999
-99.2893

4800.0 5.0329 197.6224 4789.6777 -270.1985
-101.8884

4900.0 5.1189 194.5217 4889.2866 -278.7064
-104.2738

5000.0 4.9853 195.3376 4988.9009 -287.1873
-106.5312

5100.0 4.6696 194.0107 5088.5439 -295.3431
-108.7067

5200.0 4.8125 196.7939 5188.1904 -303.3892
-111.1056

5300.0 4.1270 196.6409 5287.9019 -310.6512
-113.2668

5400.0 4.0082 195.9846 5387.6548 -317.3897
-115.2324

5500.0 3.7345 200.1333 5487.4429 -323.5798
-117.2198

5600.0 3.1377 194.0964 5587.2676 -329.2498
-118.8870

5700-0 ?.9289 190.7662 6687.1318 334 .3648

-110 R?6A

5800.0 2.9893 182.0718 5786.9893 -339.6611
-120.4160

5900.0 2.8487 167.7960 5886.8638 -344.6266

-119.8425

6000.0 2.7285 155.4521 5986.7476 -349.1448
-118.2046

6100.0 2.5765 142.0837 6086.6421 -353.0101
-115.7500

6200.0 2.9299 127.3768 6186.5244 -356.2649
-112.1740

6300.0 3.4761 120.6283 6286.3628 -359.3617
-107.4150

6400.0 3.6811 115.9902 6386.1602 -362.2882
-101.7668

6500.0 4.3745 103.5567 6485.9146 -364.7562
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-118.2046
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-115.7500

6200.0 2.9299 127.3768 6186.5244 -356.2649
-112.1740

6300.0 3.4761 120.6283 6286.3628 -359.3617
-107.4150

6400.0 3.6811 115.9902 6386.1602 -362.2882
-101.7668

6500.0 4.3745 103.5567 6485.9146 -364.7562
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7500.0 4.1145 96.3352 7482.0864 -358.4367 -9.2456

7600.0 4.0807 103.2838 7581.8237 -359.7044 -2.1203

7700.0 3.8916 106.5282 7681.5898 -361.6500 4.4345
7800.0 4.0550 104.2781 7781.3491 -363.5142 11.1108
7900.0 3.8142 98.6486 7881.1123 -364.8544 17.8493
8000.0 3.9090 92.9170 7980.8848 -365.4890 24.5608
8100.0 4.2028 89.3348 8080.6362 -365.6670 31.5984
8200.0 4.5443 88.6109 8180.3389 -365.6229 39.3003
8300.0 4.6762 86.2045 8280.0117 -365.0538 47.3540
8400.0 4.7032 86.1501 8379.6777 -364.5876 55.5176
8500.0 4.8028 83.0926 8479.3369 -363.8028 63.7252
8600.0 5.0088 80.8841 8578.9658 -362.5661 72.2422
8700.0 4.9323 82.3609 8678.5850 -361.3794 80.8723
8800.0 4.9064 80.9420 8778.2178 -360.1177 89.3455
8900.0 5.0008 75.2495 8877.8418 -358.4034 97.8245
9000.0 4.3125 79.2106 8977.5020 -356.3142 105.7774
9100.0 4.3028 75.3933 9077.2266 -354.5736 112.9749

9300.0 4.2765 76.3908 9276.7080 -351.0332 126.9211
9400.0 4.3080 78.6575 9376.4287 -349,3925 134.2044
9500.0 4.2833 76.4025 9476.1396 -347,5680 141.5826
9600.0 4.3510 75.9924 9575.8516 -345.7607 148.9465
9700.0 4.2099 71.9147 9675.5762 -343.6710 156.0641
9800.0 4.0750 72.8839 9775.3125 -341.4806 162.9695
9900.0 3.9383 75.1957 9875.0732 -339.5544 169.6158

10000.0 3.8418 75.9109 9974.8457 -337.9934 176.1727
10100.0 3.9589 73.0214 10074.6055 -336.0200 182.8080
10200.0 3.9515 68.2681 10174.3613 -333.7888 189.4244
10300.0 3.9712 71.8761 10274.1230 -331.4463 195.9035
10400.0 4.0880 68.0854 10373.8701 -328.9036 202.5440
10500.0 4.1977 64.8091 10473.6084 -325.9761 209.1573
10600.0 4.0351 65.9131 10573.3457 -322.8914 215.7002
10700.0 4.4702 65.2325 10673.0771 -320.0209 222.4367
10800.0 4.0361 62.0223 10772.7783 -316.3718 229.2328
10900.0 4.1698 56.7224 10872.5342 -312.9659 235.3158
11000.0 3.9786 55.0791 10938.3896 -310.7200 239.0500

ompany MSC EXPLORATION L.P. Schlumberger
ell: STATT=ASSC 35-1

ield: WILDCAT
ounty: (3FL4ND
tate: LTTAJA

DIRECTIONALSURVEY
- TIGHT HOLE
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STATEOFUTAH FORMS
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS ANDMINING

DESIGNATION OF AGENT OR OPERATOR

The undersigned is, on record, the holder of oil and gas lease

LEASE NAME:

LEASE NUMBER:

and hereby designates

NAME: Tidewater Oil& Gas LLC

ADDRESS: 1645 Court Place, Suite 301

¡g DENVER state CO zip 80202

as his (check one) agent G I operator 9, with full authority to act in his behalf in complying with the terms of the lease and
regulations applicable thereto and on whom the Division Director or Authorized Agent may serve written or oral instructions in
securing compliance with the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules and Procedural Rules of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining
of the State of Utah with respect to:

(Describe acreage to which this designation is applicable. Identify each oil and gas well by API number and name. Attach additional pages as
needed.)

43-019-31401 STATE MSC 16-1
43-019-31402 CACTUS ROSE MSC 2-1

APPROVED /0/d /ð o
43-019-31408 STATE MSC 35-2
43-019-31394 STATE 1-32

It is understood thatthisdesignation of agent/operator does not relieve the lessee of responsibility for compliance with the terms
of the lease and the Oiland Gas Conservation General Rules and Procedural Rules of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining of the
State of Utah. It is also understood that this designation of agent or operator does not constitute an assignment of any interest in
the lease.

In case of default on the part of the designated agent/operator,the lessee will make fulland prompt compliance with all rules, lease
terms or orders of the Board of Oil, Gas and Miningof the State of Utah or its authorized representative.

The lessee agrees to promptly notifythe Division Director or Authorized Agent of any change in this designation.

Effective Date of Designation: 10/10/2006

By: (Name) Mc OF: (company)MSC Exploration, LP

(Signature) (Address) 369 Florida HillRd.

(Title) President RIDGEFIELD

(Phone) (203) 994-1079 RECEIVED •*, cT ,, oce77

(6/2000)

UCT2 5 2006
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STATEOFUTAH FORMS
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS ANDMINING

DESIGNATION OF AGENT OR OPERATOR
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. DJJ

2. CDW
X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 2/12/2008

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N3000-Tidewater Oil & Gas Company, LLC N3440-NAE, LLC

110 16th St, Suite 1200 16800 Imperial Valley Dr, Suite 380
Denver, CO 80202 Houston, TX 77060

Phone: 1 (303) 327-7134 Phone: 1 (281) 931-8933

CA No. Unit:
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

NO TYPE STATUS
SEE ATTACHED LIST

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 2/26/2008
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 2/22/2008
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 1/15/2008
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 6666480-0161
4b. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: ok
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM not yet BIA

7. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: not yet

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: n/a

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 2/27/2008
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 2/27/2008
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 2/27/2008
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 2/27/2008
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: n/a
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: 2/27/2008
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: UTBOOO296
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: n/a
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 8030575893
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: 2/22/2008

The Division sent response by letter on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a
COMMENTS:

NAE FORM A.xis
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2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 2/27/2008
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 2/27/2008
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 2/27/2008
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: n/a
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: 2/27/2008
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: UTBOOO296
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: n/a
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 8030575893
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: 2/22/2008

The Division sent response by letter on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a
COMMENTS:

NAE FORM A.xis



STATE OF UTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GASAND MINING & LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTS ONWELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRISENAME:

7. UNITor CAAGREEMENTNAME:Do notuse thisformfor proposals todrillnewwells, significantlydeepen existing wellsbelow currentbottom-holedepth, reenterplugged wells, or to
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for suchproposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEandNU R:OILWELL Q GAS WELL OTHER

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
NAE, LLC S Ò

3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONENUMBER; 10. FIELDANOPOOL, OR WILOCAT:
16800 ImperialValley Dr. Ste. 380 HOUSTON sy,,, TX ZIP77060 (281) 931-8933

4, LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: COUNTY:

QTRíQTR, SECTION,TOWNSHIP,RANGE,MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

st. CHECKAPPROPRIATE BOXESTO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE,REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ^ciolze DEEPEN REPERFORATECURRENTFORMATIONO NOTICEOF INTENT
(Submit in Dup)Icate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximatedate workw!!Istart: CASINGREPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUSPLANS OPERATORCHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENTREPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUGBACK WATERDISPOSAL(Submit OtiginalForm Only)
O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF

Date of work completion

O COMMINGLEPRODUCENGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER:

O CONVERTWELLTYPE O RECOMPLETE- DIFFERENTFORMATION

12. DESCRIBEPROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details Includingdates, depths, volumes, etc.

NAE, LLC willbe assuming all plugging and reclamation liabilities for the wells on the schedule attached hereto.

Effective Date: 2/12/08

Federal Bond Number: UTBOOO296
State Bond Number: 8030575893

Name: Ti water Oil & Gas C mpany LLC. Address: 110 16th St., Ste 1200, Denver, CO 80202

Signatu :

Title:

Date:

SNAME(PLEASEPRINT) TITLE

(This space for State use on!" RECENED

Divisionof 011,GasandMining DN.0FOR.

Earlene Russell. Engineering
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well_name sec twp rng api entity lease well stat
FEDERAL MSC 26-1 26 210S 190E 4301931407 14785 Federal GW S
FEDERAL 7-34-2122 07 210S 220E 4301931484 Federal OW APD
BLACKHAT FED 18-43-2224 18 220S 240E 4301931495 Federal OW APD
OLD SAGERS FED 13-32-2222 13 220S 220E 4301931497 Federal_ OWRD
STATE 1-32 32 210S 190E 4301931394 13598 State OW PA
STATE 21-19 (32-16D) 32 210S 190E 4301931399 13903 State OW TA
STATE MSC 16-1 16 210S 200E 4301931401 14166 State OW S
STATEMSC35-1 35 210S 190E 4301931404 14259 State GVVS
N THOMPSON 2-1 02 210S 200E 4301931412 14376 State GW OPS
TIDEWATER ST 23-5 23 210S 230E 4301931466 16258 State OW PA
TIDEVVATERST23-2 23 210S 230E 4301931467 State GVVAPD
TIDEWATER ST 23-1 23 210S 230E 4301931468 State GW APD

well_name sec twp rng api entity lease well stat
FEDERAL MSC 26-1 26 210S 190E 4301931407 14785 Federal GW S
FEDERAL 7-34-2122 07 210S 220E 4301931484 Federal OW APD
BLACKHAT FED 18-43-2224 18 220S 240E 4301931495 Federal OW APD
OLD SAGERS FED 13-32-2222 13 220S 220E 4301931497 Federal_ OWRD
STATE 1-32 32 210S 190E 4301931394 13598 State OW PA
STATE 21-19 (32-16D) 32 210S 190E 4301931399 13903 State OW TA
STATE MSC 16-1 16 210S 200E 4301931401 14166 State OW S
STATEMSC35-1 35 210S 190E 4301931404 14259 State GVVS
N THOMPSON 2-1 02 210S 200E 4301931412 14376 State GW OPS
TIDEWATER ST 23-5 23 210S 230E 4301931466 16258 State OW PA
TIDEVVATERST23-2 23 210S 230E 4301931467 State GVVAPD
TIDEWATER ST 23-1 23 210S 230E 4301931468 State GW APD



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MíNING

Request to Transfer Application or Permit to Drill

(This form should accompany a Sundry Notice. Form 9 requesting APD transfer)

Well name: gyp
API number:

Location:

Company that filed original application gy .

Date original permit was issued:

Cornp ny th per N' 19 O

Check Desired ActÍOn:
000

Transfer pending (unapproved) Application for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drillon the property, hereby verifies that the information as
submitted in the pending Application for Permit to Drill, remains valid and does not require revision. The new
owner of the application accepts and agrees to the information and procedures as stated in the application.

Transfer approved Application for Permit to Drill to new operator
The undersignedas owner with legal rights to drillon the property as permitted, hereby verifies that the
information as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require
revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verified. . Yes No

if located on private land, h e ownership changed?

If so, has the surface agreement been updated?

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect the spacing or siting
requirements for this location?
Have there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permitting or operation of this
proposed well?
Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership or right-of-way, which could affect the
proposed location?

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed?

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a change in
plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation?

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? Bond No. Ê¶Äni S

Anydesired or necessary changes toeithera pendingor approvedApplicationfor Permit to Drillthat is being transferred,
should be filed on a SundryNotice, Form 9, or amended Application for Permit to Drill,Form 3. as appropriate, with
necessary supporting information as required.

Name (please prin MLiep Title

Signature Date 1 2(n 69
Representir npany nar e L(
The person signingthis form must have legal authority to represent the company os individual(s) to be listed as the new operator on the Application for

Permit to Doll

(3/2004) RECEIVED
FEB2 6 2008

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MíNING

Request to Transfer Application or Permit to Drill

(This form should accompany a Sundry Notice. Form 9 requesting APD transfer)

Well name: gyp
API number:
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000
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requirements for this location?
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Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership or right-of-way, which could affect the
proposed location?

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed?

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a change in
plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation?

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? Bond No. Ê¶Äni S

Anydesired or necessary changes toeithera pendingor approvedApplicationfor Permit to Drillthat is being transferred,
should be filed on a SundryNotice, Form 9, or amended Application for Permit to Drill,Form 3. as appropriate, with
necessary supporting information as required.

Name (please prin MLiep Title

Signature Date 1 2(n 69
Representir npany nar e L(
The person signingthis form must have legal authority to represent the company os individual(s) to be listed as the new operator on the Application for

Permit to Doll

(3/2004) RECEIVED
FEB2 6 2008

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER
ExecutiveDirector

Division of Oil Gas and Mining
JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.

Governor JOHN R. BAZA
Division Director

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

September 29, 2008

CERTIFIED MAIL NO.: 7004 2510 0004 1824 6343

Mr. Walter Lowry
North American Exploration, LLC
110 16* Street, STE# 1220
Denver, CO 80202

Re: State 21-19 (32-16D) API 43-019-31399: State MSC 16-1 API 43-019-31401;
Cactus Rose MSC 2-1 API 43-019-31402; State MSC 35-1 API 43-019-31404;
N Thompson 2-1 API 43-019-31412
Extended Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned Requirements for Wells on Fee or State Leases

Dear Mr. Lowry:

North American Exploration, LLC has five (5) Mineral Lease Wells (see Attachment A)
that are currently in non-compliance for extended shut-in and temporary abandonment (SI/TA)
status. It is understood that a couple of these wells have been or will be plugged shortly. Wells
SI/TA beyond twelve (12) consecutive months require the filing of a Sundry Notice in
accordance with R649-3-36-1 for Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining ("Division") approval.
Wells with five (5) years non-activity or non-productivity shall be plugged, unless the Division
grants approval for extended shut-in time upon a showing of good cause by the operator (R649-
3-36-1.3.3).

For extended SI/TA consideration the operator shall provide the Division with the following:

1. Reasons for SI/TA of the well (R649-3-36-1.1).

2. The length of time the well is expected to be SI/TA (R649-3-36-1.2), and

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone(801) 538-5340 •facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • wwwogm.utahgov OIL, GAS &
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Lieutenant Governor
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Page 2
September 29, 2008
Mr. Lowry

3. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well has
integrity, meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition, static fluid level,
pressure, existence or absence of Underground Sources of Drinking Water and
other factors do not make the well a risk to public health and safety or the
environment (R649-3-36-1.3)

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity and may help
qualify your well for extended SI/TA. Note: As of July 1, 2003, wells in violation of the SI/TA
rule R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-1-4.2, 4.3).

1. Wellbore diagram, and

2. Copy of recent casing pressure test, and

3. Current pressures on the wellbore (tubing pressure, casing pressure, and
casing/casing annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity, and

4. Fluid level in the wellbore, and

5. An explanation of how the submitted information proves integrity.

If the required information is not received within 30 days of the date of this notice, further
actions will be initiated. If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me at
(801) 538-5281.

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

JP/js
Enclosure

oc: Jim Davis, SITLA
Compliance File
Well
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Attachment A
Lease

Well Name API Type Years inactive

1 STATE 21-19 (32-16D) 43-019-31399 ML-47441 4 Years 11 Months
2 STATE MSC 16-1 43-019-31401 ML-46760 3 Years 9 Months

3 CACTUSROSE MSC 2-1 43-019-31402 ML-47721 2 Years 9 Months

4 STATE MSC 35-1 43-019-31404 ML-47576 3 Years 5 Months

5 N THOMPSON 2-1 43-019-31412 ML-46759 3 Years 10

Attachment A
Lease

Well Name API Type Years inactive

1 STATE 21-19 (32-16D) 43-019-31399 ML-47441 4 Years 11 Months
2 STATE MSC 16-1 43-019-31401 ML-46760 3 Years 9 Months
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5 N THOMPSON 2-1 43-019-31412 ML-46759 3 Years 10



State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAELR. STYLER

JON M.HUNTSMAN, JR. Executive Director
Govemor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

GARY R. HERBERT JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Governor Division Director

February 23, 2009

CERTIFIED MAIL NO.: 7005 0390 0000 7507 4238

Mr. Walter Lowry
North American Exploration, LLC
110 16'" Street, STE# 1220
Denver, CO 80202

Subject: SECOND NOTICE: Extended Shut-in and TemporarilŸ Abandoned Requirements for
Wells on Fee or State Leases

State 21-19 (32-16D) API 43-019-31399; State MSC 16-1 API 43-019-31401;
Cactus Rose MSC 2-1 API 43-019-31402; State MSC 35-1 API 43-019-31404;
N Thompson 2-1 API 43-019-31412

Dear Mr. Lowry:

North American Exploration, LLC ("NAE") has five (5) Mineral Lease Wells (see
Attachment A) that are currently in non-compliance for extended shut-in and temporary
abandonment (SI/TA) status. Wells SI/TA beyond twelve (12) consecutive months require the
filing of a Sundry Notice in accordance with R649-3-36-1 for Utah Division of Oil, Gas &
Mining ("Division") approval. Wells with five (5) years non-activity or non-productivity shall be
plugged, unless the Division grants approval for extended shut-in time upon a showing of good
cause by the operator (R649-3-36-1.3.3).

Based on a sundry dated February 13, 2008 it was understood by the Division that NAE
would be "assuming all plugging and reclamation liabilities" for the above listed wells. The N
THOMPSON 2-1 well had a sundry dated July 18, 2008 with intent to plug and abandon (P&A).
Condition of approval to P&A was sent to NAE July 22, 2008. The STATE 21-19 (32-16D) also
had a sundry dated August 22, 2008 with intent to P&A. Condition of approval to plug this well
was sent September 3, 2008. A notice of SI/TA status for wells listed (Attachment A) was sent
via certified mail September 29, 2008. To date the Division has no record of the proposed work
being done on these wells, nor received any such correspondence addressing the issue. Please
address this matter promptly.

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 •facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • www.ogm.utah.gov OII, GAS &
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DNR
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Page 2
North American Exploration, LLC
February 23, 2009

For extended SI/TA consideration the operator shall provide the Division with the
following:

1. Reasons for SI/TA of the well (R649-3-36-l.1).
2. The length of time the well is expected to be SI/TA (R649-3-36-1.2), and
3. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well has

integrity, meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition, static fluid
level, pressure, existence or absence of Underground Sources of Drinking
Water and other factors do not make the well a risk to public health and safety
or the environment (R649-3-36-1.3)

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity and may help
qualify your well for extended SI/TA. Note: As of July 1, 2003, wells in violation of the SI/TA
rule R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-1-4.2, 4.3).

1. Wellbore diagram, and

2. Copy of recent casing pressure test, and

3. Current pressures on the wellbore (tubing pressure, casing pressure, and
casing/casing annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity, and

4. Fluid level in the wellbore, and

5. An explanation of how the submitted information proves integrity.

If the required information is not received within 30 days of the date of this notice, a
notice of violation will be issued. If you have any questions concerning this matter, please
contact me at (801) 538-5281.

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

DKD/JP/js
Enclosure
cc: Jim Davis, SITLA

Compliance File
Well File

N:\O&G Reviewed
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Well File

N:\O&G Reviewed



Attachment A

Lease
Well Name API Type Years inactive

1 STATE 21-19 (32-16D) 43-019-31399 ML-47441 5 Years 3 Months
2 STATE MSC 16-1 43-019-31401 ML-46760 4 Years 2 Months
3 CACTUSROSE MSC 2-1 43-019-31402 ML-47721 3 Years 2 Months
4 STATE MSC 35-1 43-019-31404 ML-47576 3 Years 10 Months
5 N THOMPSON 2-1 43-019-31412 ML-46759 4 Years 3
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State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER
GARY R. HERBERT Executive Director

Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GREGORY S. BELL JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Govemor Division Director

February 22, 2011

Certified Mail No. 7004 1160 0003 0190 4857

DIVISION ORDER

North American Exploration, LLC
-

38C Grove Street
Richfield, CT 06877

Subject: Division Order to Plue and Abandon the Cactus Rose MSC 2-1, Cactus Rose
16-11-2118, SVA 23-33-2119 and State MSC 35-1 wells operated by North
American Enerev, LLC

To Whom It May Concern:

The Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (theDivision) received notice of North AmericanExploration, LLC (NAE) Chapter 7 Bankruptcy, District of Delaware (Case 10-13199) on
January 12, 2011.

Due to the bankruptcy the Division is concerned with NAE's future ability to continue
operating within the legal and financial constraints of the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation Act.NAE is required to be able to meet its duty to plug each dry or abandoned well, prevent waste orpollution, and maintain and restore each well site (Utah Code §40-6-5 and rule R649-3-1.2).

The Cactus Rose MSC 2-1, Cactus Rose 16-11-2118, SVA 23-33-2119 and State MSC35-1 wells are all currently in shut-in status. In addition, these wells are in noncompliance withOil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-36 (Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned Wells).

The Division is hereby ordering NAE to Plug and Abandon the Cactus Rose MSC 2-1
(API 43-019-31402), Cactus Rose 16-11-2118 (API 43-019-31546), SVA 23-33-2119 (API 43-
019-31595) and State MSC 35-1 (API 43-019-31404) wells.

The wells shall be plugged in accordance with R649-3-24. Within 30 days of receipt ofthis order NAE shall submit notices of intent sundries, for Division approval, to plug and
abandon each well.

UTAH

DNR

1594WestNorth Temple,Suite 1210,PO Box 145801,Salt LakeCity,UT 84114 -5801

telephone (801) 538-5340 . facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801)538-7458 • www.ogm.utah.gOV OIL, GAS &
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Page 2
North American Exploration, LLC
February 22, 2011

Therefore, NAE has 30 days from receipt of this Order to enter into an agreement for
execution of the Order.

NAE has the right to appeal the Division Order by filing to the Board of Oil, Gas and
Mining a request for review according to procedures set forth in R649-10-6. A request for review
of a Division Order must be filed with the secretary to the Board, Julie Ann Carter (801) 538-
5277, within 30 days of issuance of the order.

In the event NAE does not respond to the Division Plugging and Abandonment Order,
within 30 days of receipt, the Division will file for a formal hearing before the Board of Oil, Gas
and Mining, as described in the Utah Administrative Code R641, requesting a Board Order to
plug and restore the well sites. Should this matter be brought before the Board, the Division will
seek bond forfeiture (R649-3-1.16) and liability for plugging costs in excess of bond forfeiture
amounts (R649-3-1-4).

Questionsregarding this order may be directed to Clinton Dworshak, Compliance
Manager at (801) 538-5280 or Dustin Doucet, Engineer, at (801) 538-5281.

Sincerely,

Clinton Dworshak
Compliance Manager

CLD/js
cc: John Rogers, Associate Director

Steve Alder, Assistant Attorney General
Dustin Doucet, Engineer
Randy Thackeray, Lead Auditor
LaVonne Garrison, SITLA
Bill Kreussling, NAE, LLC
Michael S. Cornish, MSC Exploration
James Jones, Tidewater Oil and Gas
United States Bankruptcy Court
Compliance File
Bond File
Well

Page 2
North American Exploration, LLC
February 22, 2011

Therefore, NAE has 30 days from receipt of this Order to enter into an agreement for
execution of the Order.

NAE has the right to appeal the Division Order by filing to the Board of Oil, Gas and
Mining a request for review according to procedures set forth in R649-10-6. A request for review
of a Division Order must be filed with the secretary to the Board, Julie Ann Carter (801) 538-
5277, within 30 days of issuance of the order.

In the event NAE does not respond to the Division Plugging and Abandonment Order,
within 30 days of receipt, the Division will file for a formal hearing before the Board of Oil, Gas
and Mining, as described in the Utah Administrative Code R641, requesting a Board Order to
plug and restore the well sites. Should this matter be brought before the Board, the Division will
seek bond forfeiture (R649-3-1.16) and liability for plugging costs in excess of bond forfeiture
amounts (R649-3-1-4).

Questionsregarding this order may be directed to Clinton Dworshak, Compliance
Manager at (801) 538-5280 or Dustin Doucet, Engineer, at (801) 538-5281.

Sincerely,

Clinton Dworshak
Compliance Manager

CLD/js
cc: John Rogers, Associate Director

Steve Alder, Assistant Attorney General
Dustin Doucet, Engineer
Randy Thackeray, Lead Auditor
LaVonne Garrison, SITLA
Bill Kreussling, NAE, LLC
Michael S. Cornish, MSC Exploration
James Jones, Tidewater Oil and Gas
United States Bankruptcy Court
Compliance File
Bond File
Well



State of Utah
, DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER

GARY R.HERBERT Executive Director

Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GREGORY S. BELL JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Govemor Division Director

October 25, 2011

Certified Mail 7010167000148103133

Dodie Lilley
Wells Fargo Bank
MAC T5916-011
21314 Kuykendahl Road
Spring, TX 77379

SUBJECT: Claim Against CDs 9398350612, 9398350620, 9398350596 and 9398350604
issued by Wells Fargo Bank, as Surety on behalf of NAE, LLC, as Principal

Dear Ms. Lilley:

This letter serves as a claim against the referenced CDs by the Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining ("the Division"). North American Exploration, LLC aka NAE, LLC
("NAE") is the operator of record for the SVA Unit 23-33-2119 Well (API 43-019-31595);
Cactus Rose MSC 2-1 (API 43-019-31402); State MSC 35-1 (API 43-019-31404) and Cactus
Rose 16-11-2118 (API 43-019-31546) ("the wells"). NAE has defaulted on conditions set forth
in the referenced bond as follows: (bond copies attached)

"NOW THEREFORE, if the above bound principal shall comply with all of the
provisions of the laws of this State, and the rules and regulations and orders of the Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining of the State of Utah, including, but not limited to the proper plugging of
said well(s), and filing with the Division of the State, all notices and records required by said
office, then this obligation is void, otherwise the same shall be in full force and effect."

NAE has failed to reply to or comply with our demands for compliance with the
Shut-in/Temporarily Abandoned Well Requirements and Notice of Violation ("NOV") letters
regarding noncompliance with Division Rule R649-3-36, Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned
Wells. A Division Order to plug the well was dated February 22, 2011. Copies of those letters
and the return receipts are available upon request.

The Division has reviewed the Utah Division of Corporations and Commercial
Code concerning the whereabouts of NAE without success.

UT H

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114 -5801

telephone (80 l) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • www.ogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS &
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Page Two
Wells Fargo Bank
October 25, 2011

NAE filed Chapter 7 Bankruptcy on January 12, 2011; the Trustee's
Abandonment of Estate Property for the wells dated July 15, 2011 and August 24, 2011 are
attached. Alyse Aruch representing the Chapter Trustee sent authorization to release the CDs to
the Division dated September 20, 2011. Therefore, the Division has concluded that NAE is
defunct as the operator of the wells and that the wells have been abandoned.

The Board of Oil, Gas and Mining ("the Board") has ordered the CDs be claimed
to resolve the matter. The Division therefore requests Wells Fargo to surrender of the CDs along
with any accrued interest payable to the "State of Utah, Division of Oil, Gas & Mining" to plug
the wells and reclaim the well locations. Upon receipt of certified funds, Wells Fargo is hereby
relieved of responsibility to protect the funds for the Division

Due to the presence of potential environmental hazards at the well site, the
Division appreciates your prompt attention to this matter. If you have any questions, please
contact Dustin Doucet, Petroleum Engineer at (801) 538-5281 or John Rogers, Associate
Director - Oil and Gas Program at (801) 538-5349.

rely,

hn R. Baza
Director
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

Attachments (5)
JRB/jr/rtler

cc: James T. Jensen, Board Chairman (via e-mail)
Steve Alder, Assistant Attorney General (via e-mail)
Alyse M. Aruch, McCarter & English (via e-mail)
John Rogers, Associate Director (via e-mail)
Dustin Doucet, Petroleum Engineer (via e-mail)
LaVonne Garrison, SITLA (via state mail)
NAE, LLC Certified Mail 70101670000148103140
Bond File
Well Files

N://OG Reviewed Docs/ER/Bonds/NAE
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RELEASE

WHEREAS, NAE, LLC ("Operator"), as principal and Wells Fargo Bank ("Bond Agent"), as
bond, issued Certificates of Deposits (CDs) numbered 9398350612, 9398350620, 9398350596 and
9398350604 in the aggregate amount of One Hundred Fifty Thousand Dollars ($30,000,$60,000,
$30,000,$30,000;totaling $150,000)on November 25, 2009 in favorof the State of Utah, which CDs
provided the State some assurance that certain wells would be plugged pursuant to the rules and
regulations of the State of Utah.

WHEREAS, The State of Utah has made a demand on the operator and bond numbers under
the referenced bond, claim number 222-15 in the amounts totaling $150,000,pursuant to the terms of
the bonds.

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the payment of One Hundred Fifty Thousand and
no Dollars ($150,000),the State of Utah fully discharges and releases the bonds of any and all claims,
whether known or unknown, relating to the obligation stated within the terms of the bonds. This
release shall take full force and effect only upon receipt of certified funds by the State of Utah of the
payment in the amount totaling $150,000,referenced above.

SIGNED AND SEALED this 25th day of October, 2011.

THE STATE OF UTAH
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING:

John R. Baia, Director
STATE OF UTAH )

) ss:
COUNTY OF SALT LAKE )

On the 25th day of October 2011, personally appeared before me, John R. Baza, who being
duly sworn did say that he, the said John R. Baza, is the Director of the Division of Oil, Gas and
Mining, Department of Natural Resources, State of Utah, and he duly acknowledged to me that he
executed the foregoing release by authority of law on behalf of the State of Utah.

Notary Public'
Residing at: SC

My Commission Expires:
PENNY BERRY

NOTARYPUBUC - STATEOF UTAH
MyComm. Exp. 01/04/2015

Commission #
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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

In re:
: Chapter 7

NORTH AMERICANEXPLORATION,LLC :
: CaseNo. 10-13199 (PJW)

Debtor. :
: Related DocketNo. 43

ORDER GRANTINGCHAPTER 7 TRUSTEE'S ABANDONMENT OF ESTATE PROPERTY

Upon consideration of the Proposed Notice of Abandonment of Estate Property (the

"Notice") of the Chapter 7 Trustee for the entry of an order abandoning the estate property

known as (1) CactusRose MSC 2-1 (API# 43-019-31402) ML 47721, (2) State MSC 35-1 (API#

43-019-31404) ML 47576, and (3) CactusRose 16-11-2118 (API# 43-019-31546) ML 47575

(the "Property"); and it appearing' that the Court has jurisdictionover this matter; and it

appearing that notice of the Notice was sufficiently provided, and that no other or further notice

need be provided; and it further appearingthat the relief requested in the Notice is in the best

interestof the bankruptcy estate;and uponall of the proceedingshad beforethe Court; andafter

due deliberationand sufficient causeappearingtherefore,it is hereby

ORDEREDthat the Property is herebyabandoned;and it is further

ORDERED that the Chapter 7 Trustee is authorized and empowered to take all actions

necessary to implement the relief granted in this Order; and it is further

ORDERED that this Court shall, and hereby does, retain jurisdictionwith respectto all

matters arising fromor in relation to the implementationof this Order.

e
læw

e

The Honorable Peter J. Walsh
United States Bankruptcy Judge

MEl
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McCARTER
&ENGLISH

ATTORNEYSAT LAW

September 20, 2011

VIAE-MAILAND US MAIL

Steven F. Adler
Assistant Utah Attorney General
1594 West North Temple St. #300
Salt Lake City, Utah 84118

Re: In re North American Exploration, LLC
Chapter 7, Case No.: 10-13199 (PJW)

AlyseM.Aruch
Associate Dear Mr. Adler
T. 973.849.4157
F.973.624.7070
aamch@mccarter.com As you know, this Firm represents Charles A. Stanziale, Jr. as the Chapter Trustee

(the "Trustee") to North American Exploration, LLC (the "Debtor") in the above-
referenced bankruptcy case. The Debtor is the designated operator of the oil and
gas wells set forth below, each of which is located in Utah (the "Wells").

McCarter&English,LLP
FourGatewayCenter The Trustee understands that as operator, the Debtor is responsible for plugging
100MulberryStreet and restoring the well site for each Well. The Trustee is aware that prior to filingitsTN a3

4
02-4056

bankruptcy petition, the Debtor provided the Utah Division of Oil Gas & Mining(the
F.973.624.7070 "DÌVÍSion") with certain Certificates of Deposit (the"CDs") to be held by Wells Fargo
ww.mocariarcom Bank as bonds to secure the plugging and abandonment of theWells as requiredby

Utah state law. The amount and account number for each CD is set forth below.
On February 22, 2011 the Division issues a DivisionOrder requiringthe plugging of
the Wells. The Trustee has not and willnot be takingany steps to plug theWells.

Well Account Number Amount
BOSTON

SVA Unit #23-33-2119 #9398350612 $30,000
HARTFORD State MSC 35-1 #9398350620 $60,000

NEWYORK Cactus Rose MSC 2-1 #9398350596 $30,000

Cactus Rose 16-11-21182 #9398350604 $30,000
NEWARK

On July 15, 2011 and August 24, 2011 the Bankruptcy Court entered twoorders
PHILÀDELPHIA (the "Abandonment Orders") approvingthe Trustee's abandonment of theWells.

The Abandonment Orders authorized the Trustee to take any and all necessary
action to implement the abandonment of theWells.

STAMFORD

WILMINGTON

ME1
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September 20, 2011
Page 2

Pursuant to the Division Order and the Abandonment Orders, the Trustee hereby
authorizes the Division to instruct Wells Fargo Bank to release the CDs to the
Division.

Very trul

Alyse M. Aruch

ME1
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FILED
OCT13 2011

StevenF. Alder (00033)
er BOARDOFEmily Lewis (13280)

AssistantsUtah Attorney General
1594 West North Temple St. #300
Salt Lake City, Utah 84118
Telephone 801 538 5348

BEFORE THE BOARD OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

STATE OF UTAH

IN THE MATTER OF THE DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS,AND MINING'S NOTICE OF
AGENCYACTION FOR AN ORDER FINDINGS OF FACT,
FORFEITING TO THE STATE OF UTAH CONCLUSION OF LAW,
ALL INTEREST IN THE CERTIFICATES AND ORDER
OF DEPOSIT #9398350612, #9398350620,
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LLC: SVA UNIT #23-33-2119, STATE MSC
35-1, CACTUS ROSE MSC 2-1, AND
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reclaiming the well sites, and other relief came on for hearing on Thursday, September 29, 2011

at a regularly scheduled meeting of the



The Following members of the Board were present and participated in the hearing:

Ruland J. Gill, Jr., Kelley L. Payne, Charles D. Hansen, Carl F. Kendell, and James T. Jensen,

Chairman. Michael Johnson, Assistant Attorney General represented the Board. Division

employees, Clinton Dworshak, and Earlene Russell provided testimony and presented evidence

in support of the NAA. The Division was represented by Steven F. Alder, Assistant Utah

Attorney General. No persons appeared on behalf of the Respondent, North American

Exploration or any other party in opposition to the NAA. The Board heard the testimonyand

reviewed the pleadings and exhibits presented and being fully apprised of the premises makes the

following,

FINDINGS OF FACT

1. North American Exploration, LLC a/kla NAE, LLC ("NAE") is a Delaware

corporationqualified to do business in Utah.

2. NAE is the designated Operator of the following oil and gas wells drilled at the

following locations in Grand County, Utah:

SVA Unit #23-33-2119 Section 33 Township 21 S, Range 19 E, SLM

State MSC 35-1, Section35 Township 21 S, Range 19 E, SLM

Cactus Rose MSC 2-1, Section 2, Township 21 S, Range 18 E SLM,and

Cactus Rose 16-11-2118 Section 16, Township 21 S, Range 18 E, SLM.

3. NAE as Operator is responsible to plug the wells and restore the well sites for each of

the above wells.

4. NAE as operator provided to theDivision Certificatesof Deposit (CDs) to be held by

Wells Fargo Bank as bonds to secure the plugging and abandonment of the wells as required by

The Following members of the Board were present and participated in the hearing:

Ruland J. Gill, Jr., Kelley L. Payne, Charles D. Hansen, Carl F. Kendell, and James T. Jensen,

Chairman. Michael Johnson, Assistant Attorney General represented the Board. Division

employees, Clinton Dworshak, and Earlene Russell provided testimony and presented evidence

in support of the NAA. The Division was represented by Steven F. Alder, Assistant Utah

Attorney General. No persons appeared on behalf of the Respondent, North American

Exploration or any other party in opposition to the NAA. The Board heard the testimonyand

reviewed the pleadings and exhibits presented and being fully apprised of the premises makes the

following,

FINDINGS OF FACT

1. North American Exploration, LLC a/kla NAE, LLC ("NAE") is a Delaware

corporationqualified to do business in Utah.

2. NAE is the designated Operator of the following oil and gas wells drilled at the

following locations in Grand County, Utah:
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Wells Fargo Bank as bonds to secure the plugging and abandonment of the wells as required by



Utah code §40-6-5(2)(f)(2011) and Utah Admin. Code R649-3-1(1), in the amounts and for the

wells as shown below:

SVA Unit #23-33-2119 #9398350612, $30,000.00;

State MSC 35-1, #9398350620, $60,000.00;

Cactus Rose MSC 2-1, #9398350596, $30,000.00;and

Cactus Rose 16-11-21182. #9398350604, $30,000.00.

5. For each CD provided to the Division as a bond for the costs of plugging and restoring

the well site, NAE through its authorized agent executed a Collateral Bond agreement on the

Division's form 4B which provides that the CD's is payable to the Director of the Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining as agent of the State of Utah unless the well is properly plugged and well

site restored.

6. For each CD provided to the Division as a bond, the Division was provided a Time

Account Receipt/Disclosure (identifying the number and amount of the CD and indicatingit is to

be automatically renewed), a Time Account Maintenance Request, (indicatingthat the Payee is

the director of the Utah Division of Oil Gas and Mining), a Time Account Detail (indicatingthat

theCD are subject to a Hold), and a Hold Detail (indicatingthe Hold does not expire and that

written authorization is required to remove the restraint).

7. NAE has filed a voluntary petition under Chapter 7 of the United States Bankruptcy

code, in the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware on October 1, 2010.

8. On February 22, 2011 the Division issued its Division Order requiring the plugging of

the subject wells as required by the rules.
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9. As a result of the filingof its voluntary Chapter 7 bankruptcyand theabandonmentby

the bankruptcytrustee of any interest in the wells for which the CD's are being held, the

Operator NAE is without financial means to conduct plugging and site restoration.

10. NAE, as the operator; the bankruptcy trustee on behalf of NAE; and Dawn Trucking

as assignees have not responded to the Division Order to plug the wells and restore the sites and

have otherwise refused to plug the sites despitehaving the opportunity to do so.

11. On September 20, 2011 the bankruptcytrustee advised counsel for the Division by

letter that it had abandoned all interest in the wells and any claims to the CD's and has

authorized the Division to instruct Wells Fargo Bank to release the CD's to the Division.

CONCLUSIONS OF LAW

1. Proper and adequate notice of the hearing on the Division's NAA was given to North

American Exploration d/b/a NAE, as operator; to the bankruptcytrustee on behalf of the operator

and interests of the bankruptcy estate, if any; to Wells Fargo Bank as holder of the CD's, to

Dawn Trucking Company as assignee; and to all other persons who may be entitled to notice

under the rules of the Board.

2. NAE as Operator is responsible to plug the wells and restore the well sites for each of

the above wells.

3. The Operatorhas refused and due to thebankrupt status is otherwiseunable to

complete plugging of the wells and reclamation of the well sites.

4. It is necessary and appropriate that the Board order that the followingCertificatesof

Deposit which were provided as surety for the plugging of the wells and reclamation of the well

sites be forfeited to the Division:
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Well C_D Amount

SVA Unit #23-33-2119 #9398350612, $30,000.00;

StateMSC 35-1, #9398350620, $60,000.00;

CactusRose MSC 2-1, #9398350596, $30,000.00;and

Cactus Rose 16-11-21182. #9398350604, $30,000.00.

5. It is appropriate and necessary that upon request by the Director that Wells Fargo Bank

deliver to the Division the full face value of amount for each CD as shown above to be used by

the Division to plug the wells and restore the sites as required by the Division's rules.

6. The Division is obligated to use the forfeited funds to effect the plugging of the wells

and the restoration of the sites to the standards required by the Division's rules.

NOW THEREFORE, IT IS HEREBY ORDEREDAS FOLLOWS:

1. The following Certificates of Deposit and any accrued interestheld by Wells Fargo

Bank and provided as surety for the plugging of the listed wells and reclamation of the well sites

are ordered forfeited to the Division:

Well _C_D Amount

SVA Unit #23-33-2119 #9398350612, $30,000.00;

State MSC 35-1, #9398350620, $60,000.00;

CaetusRose MSC 2-1, #9398350596, $30,000.00;and

CactusRose 16-11-21182. #9398350604, $30,000.00.

2. The Division is Ordered to use all amounts forfeited to plug the above identifiedwells

and reclaim the well sites to the standards required by the law.
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3. The I)ivision is authorized to make demand and to take any and all actions necessary

to complete the forfeitureof the bonds, recovery of the amountsheld as surety, and to effect the

proper plugging of the wellsand restoration of the well sites.

Dated this y of October,2011

STATE OF UTAH
BOARD OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

Jam s T. Jensen, C
1 4 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah 84116
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

Docket Number: Board: X Division:
Cause Number:
WELL NAME API  NO ENTITY

NO
LEASE TYPE WELL 

TYPE
WELL
STATUS

CACTUS ROSE 16-11-2118 16 210S 180E 4301931546 16416 State OW S
CACTUS ROSE MSC 2-1 02 210S 180E 4301931402 14306 State GW S
STATE MSC 35-1 35 210S 190E 4301931404 14259 State GW S
SVA 23-33-2119 33 210S 190E 4301931595 17247 State OW S

 

DATA ENTRY:
1.    Date bond received on: 12/20/2011
2.    Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 11/30/2012
3.    Date RBDMS changed to "Calimed" on: 12/20/2011
COMMENTS:  
Per the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining well(s) moved to N9999 Orphan-No Resonsible Operator for Division plugging.

SEC  TWN  RNG

N9999-Orphan-No Responsible OperatorN3440- NAE, LLC
TO: ( New Operator):

 Operator Name Change/Merger

2011-016
222-15

    The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 12/20/2011
FROM: (Old Operator):

ORPHAN-NO RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR 
CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only)

NAE, LLC.xls  12/20/2012

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ORPHAN-NO RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR
CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only)

Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 12/20/2011

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N3440- NAE, LLC N9999-Orphan-No Responsible Operator
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
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RECEIVED: Feb. 01, 2017

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML-47576 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 STATE MSC 35-1 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 

9. API NUMBER:
 43019314040000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
  , , ,   Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 WILDCAT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0470 FNL 1320 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 35 Township: 21.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 GRAND 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

3 /3 /2016

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Well was plugged as part of the Orphan Well Plugging program PWO
2015-01. Work was completed on 3/3/2016. See attached for details.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Dustin Doucet 801 538-5281

TITLE
 Engineer

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 2 /1 /2017

February 02, 2017

Sundry Number: 77891 API Well Number: 43019314040000Sundry Number: 77891 API Well Number: 43019314040000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-47576

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
STATE MSC 35-1

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
43019314040000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
Ext WILDCAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: GRAND

0470 FNL 1320 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNW Section: 35 Township: 21.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

3 / 3 / 2 0 16
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Well was plugged as part of the Orphan Well Plugging program PWO Accepted by the2015-01. Work was completed on 3/3/2016. See attached for details. Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
February 02, 2017

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Dustin Doucet 801 538-5281 Engineer

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 2/1/2017

RECEIVED: Feb. 01,



RECEIVED: Feb. 01, 2017

Sundry Number: 77891 API Well Number: 43019314040000Sundry Number: 77891 API Well Number: 43019314040000

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

ML-47576

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF N/DIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to dnli new wells, signifcantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° Salt Valle Anticline Unitdrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL . GAS WELL OTHER State MSC 35-1

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Utah DOG&M with A-Plus Well Service Inc - Contractor 4301931404
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

PO Box 1979 m Farmington NM ,87499 (505) 325-2627 Wildcat
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 470' FNL; 1320' FWL coUNTY: Grand

QTR/QTR. SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNW 35 21S 19E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start: CASlNG REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUB1NGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER:

CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE-DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Well was plugged and abandoned on March 3, 2016 per the attached report.

Work was completed under PWO - 2015-01.

P&A Marker was sent at Lat: 38o 56' 53" N and Long: 1090 47' 33" W.

William F. Clark President (A-Plus)
SNAME(PlREEASE T

4/4/2016

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



RECEIVED: Feb. 01, 2017

Sundry Number: 77891 API Well Number: 43019314040000Sundry Number: 77891 API Well Number: 43019314040000

A-PLUS WELLSERVICE, INC.
P.O. BOX 1979

Farmington, New Mexico87499
505-325-2627 *fax: 505-325-1211

State of Utah . March 3, 2016
State MSC 35-1 Page 1 of 2

470' FNL and 1320' FWL, Section 35, T-21-S, R-19-E
Grand County, UT Plug and Abandonment Report
Lease Number: MN-47576 Notified Utah DOG&M on 2/26/16
API #43-019-31404

Plug and Abandonment Summary:

Plug #1 with 5.5" CIBP at 7400'; wireline dump bail 11 sxs Class B cement from 7400' to 7320'
in 4 runs to isolate the Cutler perforations. No WOC or tag; casing pressure tested.

Plug #2 with CIBP at 5050'; set balanced plug with 72 sxs (85.0 cf) Class B cement from 5050'
to 4399' inside casing to isolate the Moenkopi perforations and to cover Wingate top.
No WOC.

Plug #3 with 24 sxs (28.3 cf) Class B cement with 2% CaCl2 inSide casing from 3785' to 3568'
to cover the Navajo top. WOC for 3 hours. TIH and tag TOC at 3588'.

Plug #4 with 22 sxs (26.0 cf) Class B cement inside casing from 2308' to 2109' to cover the
Dakota top.

Plug #5 with 3 squeeze holes (each) at 500' and 100'; set a balance plug with 77 sxs (90.9 cf)
inside the 5.5" casing from 553' to surface to cover the surface casing shoe; nothing
into BH annulus.

Plug #6 with 5 sxs Class B cement top off 5.5" casing, 14' down and annulus at surface, and
install P&A Marker at Lat: 38° 56' 53" N and Long: 109°47' 33" W.

Pluqqinq Work Details:

2/26/16 Drive rig and equipment. SDFD.

2/29/16 MOLand RU. Check well pressures: tubingand casing 0 PSI. ND WH (bolts very rusty) and
NU BOP. Unseat tubinghanger and found 2.875" tubing in well. Pull and LD78 joints2.875"

EUE tubing;total 2439'. Held safety meeting with WL. RIH with gauge ring to 7430'. Tight
spots at 4550' and 5577'. RIH and set 5.5" PlugWell CIBP at 7400'. Shut In Well. SDFD.

3/1/16 Check well pressures: Casing - 0 PSI. RU wireline and dump ball Plug #1 on topof CIBP at
7400'. Set 5.5" PlugWell wireline CIBP at 5050'. Connect pump line to the bradenhead valve
and attempt to pressure. Pressure up BHannulus to 200#; and it bleeds off in 2 minutes. PU
A-Plus string milland 160 joints A-Plus workstring. TlH and tag CIBP at 5050'. Circulate
casing clean with 120 bbl. of water. Pressure test casing to 800 PSI held ok. TOH and LD

string mill.TIHwith open ended tubingto 5000'. SI Well.



RECEIVED: Feb. 01, 2017

Sundry Number: 77891 API Well Number: 43019314040000Sundry Number: 77891 API Well Number: 43019314040000

A-PLUS WELL SERVICE, INC.
P.O. BOX 1979

Farmington, New Mexico 87499
505-325-2627 *fax: 505-325-1211

State of Utah March 3, 2016
State MSC 35-1 Page 2 of 2

Pluqqinq Work Detail Continued:

3/2/16 Check casing pressure: 0 PSI. Tag ClBP at 5050' with tubing. Set Plug #2. TOH with tubing
to 3785'. Set Plug #3. TOH and shut in well and WOC. Dig out WH. TIH and tag TOC at
3588'. TOH to 2308'. Set Plug #4. TOH with tubing. Perforate 3 HSC holes at 500'.
Attempt to established circulation to surface out the BH valve. Casing pressured up to 800
PSI; unable to establish rate. Perforate 3 HSC holes at 100'. Attempt to established
circulation to surface out the BH valve. Pressure up casing to 800 PSI: no rate, no bleed off.
Procedure change to set an inside plug approved by D. Doucet with DOG&M. TIH with tubing
to 563'. Set Plug #5. TOH and LD all tubing. Fill5.5" casing with 8 sxs cement. Shut in well
and WOC. SDFD.

3/3/16 Check well pressures: O PSI. Tag cement inside 5.5" casing at 18' down (includingBOP). ND
BOP. Issue Hot Work Permit. Cut off WH. Found cement at surface in the 5.5" x 8.625" BH
annulus. Plug #6: to fill the casing from 14' to surface and install P&AMarker. RDand MOL.

Dustin Doucet, State of Utah representative, was on location.

P&AMarker at Lat: 38° 56' 53" N and Long: 109°47' 33"



RECEIVED: Feb. 01, 2017

Sundry Number: 77891 API Well Number: 43019314040000Sundry Number: 77891 API Well Number: 43019314040000

Daily Report A - PLt - WELL SERVICE 4e 4
P.O.BOX 1979 • FARMINGTON, NM 87499

505-325-2627 • FAX (505) 325-1211

Rig No Date A Al.-IL Day f-g/

Well Name 32NTE máf. YÑ-/ Company ATA tyr4#
,,4,7

ys-o/7-3/VDY
#R0M TO DESCRÌPTION 060PEÁÀTÏØÑ..

Fuel & MotorOil Water Hauled
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/5, ÑN/0/M/A Ÿ $ .22

Operator
f) .BrV //R. Yo i 2.2 f /

Derrick
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Floors

Floors
REPROGRAPHICS



RECEIVED: Feb. 01, 2017

Sundry Number: 77891 API Well Number: 43019314040000Sundry Number: 77891 API Well Number: 43019314040000

Daily Report A - P S WELL SERVICE / '25
P.O. BOX 879 • FARMINGTON, NM 87499

505-325-2627 • FAX (505) 325-1211

Rig No Date 19-¾, Day rYIrar)

WellName TT4TT. /VING 3Â-Ê Company.-fT4¾ / J-crdd

FROM TO DESCRIPTION OF OPERATION

4 no 4;,so ( Ar>4p st ‡†µm.s
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REPROGRAPHICS



RECEIVED: Feb. 01, 2017

Sundry Number: 77891 API Well Number: 43019314040000Sundry Number: 77891 API Well Number: 43019314040000

DaHy Report A - PLod WELL SERVICE 480 ,

P.O. BOX 1979 • FARMINGTON, NM 87499
505-325-2627 • FAX (505) 325-1211

RigNo 4 Date 3-I-II, Day 77.45.

WdlName,51472- hi,5C 35-I Company $NYC 4/ -rTuel

FROM TO ÜÈSCNPTION OF OPERATION

/wine 7tors TMU/-i.. 77> Anc-.
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¿Y
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RECEIVED: Feb. 01, 2017

Sundry Number: 77891 API Well Number: 43019314040000Sundry Number: 77891 API Well Number: 43019314040000

Daily Report A - Ps S WELL SERVICE 48L 3
P.O. BOX 1979 • FARMINGTON, NM 87499

505-325-2627 • FAX (505) 325-1211

Rig No Ÿ Date 3 2-¡/-, Day ra:E O.

Well Name,77/97x tri,s¢ 35-/ __. Company 5f#ft / I-(Tof//

FROM TO dESCRIPTION OF OPERATION
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RECEIVED: Feb. 01, 2017

Sundry Number: 77891 API Well Number: 43019314040000Sundry Number: 77891 API Well Number: 43019314040000

Daily Report A - PI. i WELL SERVICE 48C
P.O. BOX 1979 • FARMINGTON, NM 87499

505-325-2627 • FAX (505) 325-1211

Rig No 'l Date W. 3- (6 Day THu

Wall Name FT47E rrf yr 35- I Company smT2. e /474//

FROM TO DESCRIPTION OF OPERATION

i
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