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PROVIDING PERMITS for LAND USERS Ma 18, 2004
37 Verano Loop, Santa Fe, New Mexico 87508 (505) 466-8120

Diana Whitney
Utah Div. of Oil,Gas, & Mining
P. O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Ut. 84114-5801

Dear Diana,

On behalf of MSC Exploration L. P., I am applying for approval of an exception
location for their Cactus Rose MSC 2-1 wildcat oil well in Section 2, T. 21 S.,
R. 18 E., Grand County. I am requesting an exception because of topography.

This wellis staked at 1110' FSL & 495' FEL on a 342.92 acre state lease. An
orthodox well could be staked at 860' FSL & 495' FEL, but this would be too
rugged. There will be 20' of cut on the location "as is". (MSC wanted to drill
at 557' south of the requested location, but that was even more rugged.)
MSC is requesting permission to drill at 1110' FSL & 495' FEL 2-21s-18e.

This is the only oil or gas well existing or planned in the quarter-quarter. The
only well of any type within a mile radius is a P&A well over 4,000' southeast.
Closest lease line is 495' east. MSC is owner of all drilling units within a
minimum 495' radius of the proposed exception. This includes all of Section 2
and at least three of the eight directly or diagonally offsetting drilling units.
The unit (NESE Sec. 2) toward which the well encroaches is part of the same
MSCState lease.

Please keep this well "CONFIDENTIAL".
Sincerely

I

Brian Wood

cc: Faust

MAY2 0 2004
Div oF o!L GS &



STATE OF UTÁH FORM 3
DEPARTMENT OF NATÚBALRESÖURCES

$$ DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING AMENDED REPORT O
(highlight changes)

5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL ML-47721

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:
1A.TYPEOFWORK: DRILL REENTER DEEPEN N/A

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
B. TYPE OF WELL: OIL GAS OTHER SINGLE 2ONE MULTIPLEZONE 2 N/A

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

MSC EXPLORATIONL. P. 16800 IMPERIAL VALLEY DR., SUITE 380 CACTUS ROSE MSC 2-1
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9 FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

CITY HOUSTON STATE TX ze 77060 (281) 931-8933 MnWB¾r y & fi
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) 10. QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

ATSURFACE: 1110 FSL &495 FEL F9f'lit 3 I Î
SMESRIDIAN:

2 21S 18E S
AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONE: SAME &I $9 - / 49. 29 ŸAU

13. DISTANCE IN MILESAND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: 11. COUNTY: 12. STATE:

21 MILES NE OF GREEN RIVER GRAND
UTAH

14. DISTANCE TO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE (FEET) 15. NUMBEROF ACRES IN LEASE: 16. NJMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:

495 343 160
17. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING,COMPLETED, OR 18. PROPOSED DEPTH: 19. BOND DESCRIPTION:

APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET)

N/A 7,700 SINGLE (to be submitted)
20. ELEVATIONS(SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 21. APPROXIMATE DATE WORK WILLSTART: 22. ESTIMATEDDURATION:

5,440 GL 6/1/2004 6 WEEKS (to drill&complete)

23. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

SIZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY,YIELD,AND SLURRY WEIGHT

10-5/8 8-5/8 J-55 500 CLASS G 175 SX 1.18 15.2

7-7/8 5-1/2 N-80 17 7, O BLEND 300 SX 3.82 11.0

50/50 PO2 300 SX 1.21 14.4

24. ATTACHMENTS

VERIFY THE FOLLOWINGARE ATTACHED INACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAHOIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES:

WELLPLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLINGPLAN

2 EVIDENCE OF DIVISIONOF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANYOTHER THANTHE LEASE OWNER

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) BRIAN WOOD PHONE: (505) 466-8120
TITLE CONSULTANT FAX:(505) 466-9682

SIGNATURE DATE 5/18/2004

(This space for State use only)

API NUMBERASSIGNED:
GAS&M NG

(5/2000) e I on o v S
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WellLocation Description
MSC EXPLORATION.L.P.
CACTUS ROSEMSC * 2 - IIIO°FSL & 495° FEL
Section 2. T.21S.. R.\8 E. SLM
Grand County.UT5440° grd. el. ( fromGPS) ptBog

© No. 161297

05/06/°04
Gerald G. Huddleston. LS

The above is true and correct to my knowbdgeand belief.

HUDDLESTONLANDSURVEYING- BOXKK - CORTEZ.CO - (970) 565



003
MSCExploration L. P. PAGE 1
Cactus Rose MSC2-1
1110' FSL & 495' FEL
Sec. 2, T. 21 S., R. 18 E.
Grand County, Utah CONFIDENTIAL

Drillina Program

1. Formation Name Depth from GL Depth from KB Elevation
Mancos Shale O' 12' +5,440'

Dakota Sandstone 3,745' 3,757' +1,695'

Morrison 3,865' 3,877' +1,575'

Moab Tongue 4,555' 4,567' +885'

Navajo Sandstone 5,195' 5,207' +245'

Wingate Sandstone 5,995' 6,007' -555'

.White Rim Sandstone 7,395' 7,407' -1,955'

Total Depth 7,700' 7,712' -2,260'

(All depths are based on an ungraded ground level of 5,440')

2. NOTABLEZONES

Pennsylvanian is the primary goal. Other potential oil or gas zones are the
Dakota, Moab, Navajo, Wingate, and White Rim. The Glen Canyon group of
sandstones are possible water zones.

3. PRESSURECONTROL(Also see "5." on PAGE 2)

A 3,000 psi BOP and choke manifold will be used from the bottom of the
surface casing to TD. (A typical 3,000 psi BOP system is on Page 3. Actual
model will not be known until the bid is let.) BOP Equipment and the 8 5/8
casing will be pressure tested to rated pressures prior to drilling out of the
8 5/8" surface casing. BOP rams will be function tested on trips and the
stack will be pressure tested every 30 days if necessary. Tests will be
recorded in the driller's log. BOPs will be inspected and operated daily to
assure good mechanical working order.

.INC
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MSCExploration L. P. PAGE2

Cactus Rose MSC2-1
1110' FSL& 495' FEL
Sec. 2, T. 21 S., R. 18 E.
Grand County, Utah CONFIDENTIAL

4. ÇASING& CEMENTING

Hole Size O. D. Weight Grade Tvoe A Settinq Depth

10-5/8" 8-5/8" 24 J-55 ST & C New 500'
7-7/8" 5-1/2" 17 N-80 LT & C New 7,700'

All tubular goods will be new or inspected to premium specifications. Casing

strings will be pressure tested to 0.22 psi/ft of casing string length or to

1,500 psi whichever is greater (not to exceed 70% of the internal yield

strength of the casing), after cementing and prior to drilling out from under

the casing shoe. Surface casing shoe will be set in a competent formation. A

pressure integrity test of each casing shoe shall be performed. Formation at

the shoe shall be tested to a minimum of the mud weight equivalent

anticipated to control the formation pressure to the next casing depth or at

total depth of the well. This test shall be performed before drilling more than

20 feet of new hole.

Surface casing will be cemented to the surface with ~175 sacks (~100%
excess) Class G (weight = 15.2 pounds per gallon & yield 1.18 cubic feet per

sack).

Production casing will be cemented to the surface with >10% excess. Lead

cement will consist of ~300 sacks Blend weight (weight = 11.0 pounds per

gallon & yield = 3.82 cubic feet per sack). Tail with ~300 sacks 50/50 poz

(weight = 14.4 pounds per gallon & yield 1.21 cubic feet per sack). Wait on

cement, set slips with casing in full tension. Actual volumes to be determined

after reviewing logs and shows. All potentially productive zones will be

covered with cement.

5. MUD PROGRAM

Will drill from surface to ~500' with air and/or fresh water mud system. Will

drill remainder of hole with air and/or LSND.

.INC
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FLOWLINE
FILLLINE

TYPICALBOPSTACK

ANNULAR &CHOKEMANIFOLD

There will be at least 2 chokesand 2 choke
line valves (3" minimum). Thechokeline
will be 3" in diameter. There will be a
pressure gaugeonthechokemanifold.

RAM TO PIT

Killsideoutletmustbe Chokesideoutletmustbe

minimum2" diameter. minimum3" diameter. TOPIT

TOPIT

Kill line will be minimum2" diameter
andhave 2 valves, oneof which shall
be a minimum 2" check valve.

Upper kelly cockwill havehandleavailable
Safety valve and subs will fit all drill string connectionsin use

All 80PE connectionssubjected to well pressure will be flenged, welded,or clamped

PER S WEST,INC.

PROVIDING PERMITS for the EN£RGY



MSCExploration L. P. PAGE 4
Cactus Rose MSC2-1
1110' FSL & 495' FEL
Sec. 2, T. 21 S., R. 18 E.
Grand County, Utah CONFIDENTIAL

6. DATA GATHERING

May cut cores or may run drill stem tests depending on shows. Mud loggers
will be on site from ~500' to TD and will collect samples every 10'. They will
have FIDand chromatograph unit. Willrun following log suites:

GR/Dual Induction - SFL
GR/Bore Hole Compensated Sonic

GR/Neutron Density
Continuous Dip meter - FMI

Gamma Ray - Directional

7. DOWNHOLECONDITIONS

Maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure is ~3,300 psi. No hydrogen
sulfide, abnormal pressures, nor abnormal temperatures are expected.

8. MISCELLANEOUS

Projected spud date is June 1, 2004. It will take ~4 weeks to drill the well and
~2 weeks to complete the well.

.INC
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MSCExploration L. P. PAGE 5
Cactus Rose MSC2-1
1110' FSL & 495' FEL
Sec. 2, T. 21 S., R. 18 E.
Grand County, Utah CONFIDENTIAL

Surface Use Plan

1. EXISTINGROADS& DIRECTIONS(See PAGES9 & 10)

From the Ranch Exit #173 on 1-70
...

Go West 0.3 miles on the paved frontage road
then turn right and go NE 3.4 miles on dirt county road 225
Then turn left and go N 2.3 miles on dirt county road 226
Then turn left and go NW 2.4 miles on dirt county road 226/329
Then turn left and follow flagging cross country W for 449.55' to the well

2. ROADTO BE UPGRADED& BUILT

Upgrading will consist of installing an 18" x 20' culvert and trimming a hilltop
in Section 11. These two actions will reduce vertical curves and eliminate
high centering. Road will not be widened or realigned.

The last 449.55' of road will be built with a minimum 14' wide running
surface. Maximum disturbed width = 25'. Maximum grade = 10%. Maximum

cut or fill = 10'. No cattle guard is needed.

3. EXISTINGWELLS

There are no existing injection, disposal, oil, or gas wells within a mile radius.

4. PROPOSEDPRODUCTIONFACILITIES

A tank battery, separator, and pump will be installed on the pad. All surface
equipment will be painted a flat tan or juniper green color.

,INC
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MSCExploration L. P. PAGE 6
Cactus Rose MSC2-1
1110' FSL & 495' FEL
Sec. 2, T. 21 S., R. 18 E.
Grand County, Utah CONFIDENTIAL

5. WATERSUPPLY

Water will be trucked from Thompson and Marsing Construction and Ready
Mix (right #92-117) in Green River or Thompson Special Service District
(right #92-180) in Thompson Springs.

6. CONSTRUCTIONMATERIALS& METHODS

Topsoil and brush will be stripped and stockpiled east of the pad. Excess
.subsoil will be formed into a berm and stored south of the pad. A diversion
ditch will be cut southwest of the pad. The reserve pit will be lined with
minimum 12 milplastic. Gravelwill be bought from a private landowner.

7. WASTEDISPOSAL

The reserve pit will be fenced 4' high on 3 sides with 4 strands of barbed
wire or woven wire topped with barbed wire. The fourth side will be fenced
once the rig moves off hole. The fence will be kept in good repair while the pit
dries.

All trash will be placed in a trash cage. When full, it will be hauled to a state
approved landfill. There will be no trash burning or disposal of trash in the
reserve pit. Chemical toilets will be used for human waste. Their contents will
be disposed of in state approved facilities.

No oil will be allowed on the reserve pit. Any oil which accumulates on the pit

will be pumped or skimmed off and hauled to a state approved recycle
facility. Once dry, the reserve pit contents will be buried in place. The pit will
be back filled sufficiently deep so no liner is exposed.

.INC
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MSCExploration L. P. PAGE7
Cactus Rose MSC2-1
1110' FSL & 495' FEL
Sec. 2, T. 21 S., R. 18 E.
Grand County, Utah CONFIDENTIAL

8. ANÇ\LLARYFACILITIES

There will be no airstrip or formal camp. Camper trailers will be on site for
the company man, roughnecks, mud logger, tool pusher, etc.

9. WELLSITELAYOUT

See PAGES12 & 13 for depictions of the well pad, cross sections, cut and fill
diagrams, reserve pit, burn pit, access road onto the pad, parking, living

.facilities, and rig orientation.

10. RECLAMATION

After completing drilling, the well site and immediate area will be cleared of
all debris and material not needed for production.

Reclamation will start when the reserve pit is dry. At least 2' of cover will be
placed on the reserve pit. AII areas not needed for production will be back
filled, contoured to match natural contours, and reserved topsoil and brush
evenly spread. If the well is a producer, then enough topsoil willbe kept aside
to reclaim the rest of the pad. Disturbed areas will be ripped, harrowed, or
scarified before seeding.

All reclaimed areas will be broadcast seeded in late fall or winter with seed
mix specified by the State. Seeded areas will be left rough and lightly
harrowed or drug with a chain after seeding.

Entire well site and 449.55' of new road will be reclaimed once the well is
plugged and abandoned. Road will be blocked and four water bars installed.

,INC
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MSCExploration L. P. PAGE8
Cactus Rose MSC2-1
1110' FSL & 495' FEL
Sec. 2, T. 21 S., R. 18 E.
Grand County, Utah CONFIDENTIAL

11. SURFACEOWNER

All well site and most road construction is on lease and on State and

Institutional Trust Land Authority land. The east most 90.78' of road is on

BLMfor which a road right-of-way application willbe filed.

12. OTHERINFORMATION

Closest first aid is the Green River Medical Center at 305 West Main in Green

River, Utah. Its phone number is (435) 564-3434. It is a 1/2 hour drive.

Archaeology report (GRI #2415) was filed by Grand River on May 14, 2004.

13. REPRESENTATION

Anyone having questions concerning the APD should contact:

Brian Wood
Permits West, Inc.
37 Verano Loop
Santa Fe, NM87508
(505) 466-8120 FAX:(505) 466-9682 Mobile: (505) 699-2276

The operator's contact is:

Lynn Faust or Jack Stanley
MSC Exploration L. P.
1 6800 Imperial Valley Dr., Suite 380
Houston, TX 77060
(281) 931-8933 FAX (281) 931-8655 Mobile: (832) 434-9900

.INC
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MSCExploration L. P. PAGE12
Cactus Rose MSC2-1
1110' FSL & 495' FEL
Sec. 2, T. 21 S., R. 18 E.
Grand County, Utah CONFIDENgH
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WORKSHEET
004 APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 05/20/2004 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-019-31402

WELL NAME: CACTUS ROSE MSC 2-1

OPERATOR: MSC EXPLORATION, LP ( N2595 )

CONTACT: BRIAN WOOD PHONE NUMBER: 505-466-8120

PROPOSED LOCATION:

SESE 02 2105 180E INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
SURFACE: 1110 FSL 0495 FEL Tech Review Initials Date
BOTTOM: 1110 FSL 0495 FEL

Engineering

UNDESIGNATED ( 2 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 3 - State Surface
LEASE NUMBER: ML-47721

SURFACE OWNER: 3 - State
LATITUDE: 39.01068

PROPOSED FORMATION: WHRM

COALBED METHANE WELL? NO LONGITUDE: 109.89400

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

V Plat R649-2-3.

v/ Bond: Fed[] Ind[] Sta[3] Fee[]
Unit

(No• Û -ÛÛ$ )
|\A Potash (Y/N) R649-3-2. General

!\l Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Otr/Qtr & 920'Between Wells

v/ Water Permit /"R649-3-3. Exception
CNo.92-180 )

Drilling UnitÁ RDCC Review (Y/N)
Board Cause No:(Date: )
Eff Date:

JA Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS: (, Ô$

STIPULATIONS:



T20S R18E

T2tS RISE

C.aCTL $ ROSI
4160 1 I
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lil

BLAZE CANYON FIE D

ßl \ZI \ I

OPERATOR: MSC EXPLORATION LP (N2595)

SEC. 2 T.2lS, R.18E

FIELD: UNDESIGNATED (002)

COUNTY:GRAND

CAUSE: R649-3-3 / EXCEPTION LOCATION

WeBStat. Utah OilGas and Mining
GASINJECTION

GAS STORAGE Unit Status

LOCATION ABANDONED EXPLORATORY

NEW LDCATION GAS STORAGE

+ PLUGGED 8: ABANDONED NF PP OIL

PRODUCING GAS NF SECONDARY
Field Status

• PRODUCING OIL PENDING ABANDONED

SHUT-IN GAS PI OIL ACTIVE

• SHUT-IN OIL
PP GAS COMBINED

X TEMP. ABANDONED
PPGEOTHERML INACTIVE

A

WEATEWREI

ECTION
PP OIL PROPOSED

* WATERSUPPLY
SECONDARY STORAGE PREPARED BY:DIANA WHITNEY

/ WATERDISPOSAL TERMINATED TERMINATED DATE



ON-SITE PREDRILL EVALUATION
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

OPERATOR: MSC Exploration L.P.
WELL NAME & NUMBER: Cactus Rose 2-1
API NUMBER: 43-019-31402

LEASE: State FIELD/UNIT:
LOCATION: 1/4,1/4 SESE Sec: 2 TWP: 21S RNG: 18E 1110 FSL 495 FEL
LEGAL WELL SITING: 460 F SEC. LINE; 460 F 1/4,1/4 LINE; 920 F ANOTHER WELL.

PARTICIPANTS
M. Jones (DOGM), Brian Wood (Permits West).

REGIONAL/LOCAL SETTING & TOPOGRAPHY

Proposed location is ~2 miles northeast of Green River, Utah in the Floy
Canyon area. Staked location lies north of I-70 exit 175 about 1.25
miles. Approximately 450' of new access will be built to access this
well. There is a 90' piece of road that will be on BLM surface, for
which a right-of-way from the BLM has been initiated. The direct area
drains to the southeast.

SURFACE USE PLAN

CURRENT SURFACE USE: Wildlife habitat and grazing.

PROPOSED SURFACE DISTURBANCE: 200' x 285' and a 165' x 60' x 10' pit.
450 feet of new access road will be built for this well.

LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHIN A 1 MILE RADIUS: 1 PA well within a 1
mile radius.

LOCATION OF PRODUCTION FACILITIES AND PIPELINES: Production facilities
will be on location and no pipeline is planned for at this time.

SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL: Obtained locally and transported in.

ANCILLARY FACILITIES: None anticipated.

WASTE MANAGEMENT PLAN:

The reserve pit will be fenced 4' high on 3 sides with 4 strands of
barbed wire or woven wire topped with barbed wire. The fourth side will
be fenced once the rig moves off the hole. The fence will be kept in
good repair while the pit dries. All trash will be placed in a trash
cage. When full, it will be hauled to a state approved landfill. There
will be no trash burning or disposal of trash in the reserve pit.
Chemical toilets will be used for human waste. Their contents will be
disposed of in state approved facilities. No oil will be allowed on the
reserve pit. Any oil which accumulates on the pit will be skimmed off
and hauled to a state approved recycle facility. Once dry, the reserve
pit contents will be buried in place. The pit will be back filled
sufficiently deep so no liner is



ENVIRONMENTAL PARAMETERS

AFFECTED FLOODPLAINS AND/OR WETLANDS: Dry washes.

FLORA/FAUNA: 4-winged salt brush, grasses, sagebrush, globe mallow,
prickly pear, deer, antelope, small game, raptors and other fowl,
rodents and reptiles.

SOIL TYPE AND CHARACTERISTICS: Rocky sandy loam.

EROSION/SEDIMENTATION/STABILITY: Stable until disturbed.

PALEONTOLOGICAL POTENTIAL: None observed.

RESERVE PIT

CHARACTERISTICS: Dugout earthen.

LINER REQUIREMENTS (Site Ranking Form attached): None required.

SURFACE RESTORATION/RECLAMATION PLAN

As per surface use agreement.

SURFACE AGREEMENT: As per SITLA.

CULTURAL RESOURCES/ARCHAEOLOGY: Arch survey completed by Grand River
Institute.

OTHER OBSERVATIONS/COMMENTS

ATTACHMENTS

Photos of this location were taken and placed on file.

Mark L. Jones May 20, 2004 / 4:00 pm
DOGM REPRESENTATIVE





LINDQUIST & VENNUM P.L.L.P.
IN MINNEAPOLIS:
4200 IDSCENTER INST. PAUL:

600 17TH STREET, SUITE 1800 SOUTH 80 SOUTH EIGHTHSTREET 444 CEDAR STREET, SUITE 1700
DENVER, CO 80202-5441 MINNEAPOUS, MN 55402-2274 ST. PAut, MN 55101-3157
TELEPHONE:303-573-5900 TELEPHONE: 612-371-3211 TELEPHONE: 651-312-1300

FAx: 303-573-1956 FAx: 612-371-3207 FAx: 651-223-5332

ATTORNEYSAT I.AW www.lindquist.com

MARILYNR. DAVIES
(303)454-0535
mdavies@lindquist.com

May 21, 2004

VIA OVERNIGHT MAIL

UT Division of Oil Gas and Mining
1594 W.N. Temple, #1210
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Attention: Earlene Russell

Re: Designations of Agent or Operator
Lease Numbers ML-47721, and FE-10001

Dear Earlene:

Enclosed are two Designations of Agent of Operator for lands in Grand County UT for
filing with the State of Utah. I have enclosed an extra copy of the Designations and a self-

addressed stamped envelope. Please return a stamped copy for our records.

Feel free to call me if you have any questions or you need additional information.

Very truly yours,

L T NNUM P.L.L.P.

aril R. Davi s
Encs.
cc: Jim Jones

MAY24 2004

Doc#



STATE OF UTAH FORM5

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS ANDMINING

DESIGNATIONOF AGENTOR OPERATOR

The undersignedis, on record, the holder of oiland gas lease

LEASE NUMBER: MLB 11 2 (

and hereby designates

NAME: Y\¾C.- Ex ombitors . L.9 «

ADDRESS: \GioD eni.Mo e LA. MidL 3 O

city Sp ype state TK zip 77pt,O

as his (check one) agent O I operator with full authority to act in his behalf in complyingwith the terms of the lease and

regulations applicablethereto and on whomthe Division Director or Authorized Agent may serve writtenor oral instructions in

securingcompliance withtheOiland Gas Conservation General Rules and Procedural Rules oftheBoard of Oil, Gas and Mining

ofthe State of Utah withrespect to:

(Describe acmage lo which thisdesignation is applicable. Identify each oil and gas well by API number and name. Attach additional pages as

needed.)

It is understoodthatthisdesignation ofagent/operatordoes not relieve the lessee of responsibility for compliancewiththeterms
ofthe lease and the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules and Procedural Rules of the Board of Oil, Gas and Miningofthe
State of Utah. It is also understoodthatthisdesignation ofagent or operator does notconstitute an assignmentofany interest in

the lease.

Incase ofdefault on the part ofthedesignated agent/operator, the lessee willmake fulland prompt compliance with all rules, lease

termsor orders of the Board of Oil, Gas and Miningof the State of Utah or its authorizedrepresentative.

The lessee agrees to promptly notifythe DivisionDirector or Authorized Agent of any change in this designation.

Effective Date of Designation: 5 -\

BY: (Name) OF: (Company) Sc. So toC En

(Signature) (Address) V fo 4



INSTRUCTIONS

If a well is to be operated or a company's business is to be conducted by an individualor company other
than the lessee, then a designation of agent or operator shall be submitted to the division prior to the
commencementof operations. Adesignation ofagentor operatorwill,for purposes ofthegeneral rulesand
orders, be accepted as evidence of authorityof agent to fulfillthe obligations of the owner,to sign any

requireddocuments or reportson behalf ofthe owner, and to receive allauthorized orders or noticesgiven

by the board or the division. AIIchanges of address and any terminationof the designated agent's or

operator's authorityshallbe promptly reportedin writingtothedivision, andin the latter case a designation

of a new agent or operatorshall be promptly made,

Send to:

Utah Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801



DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

STATEMENT OF BASIS

OPERATOR: MSC Exploration L.P.
WELL NAME & NUMBER: Cactus Rose 2-1

API NUMBER: 43-019-31402
LOCATION: 1/4,1/4 SESE See: 2 TWP: 21S RNG: 18E 1110 FSL 495 FEL

Geology/Ground Water:

Significant volumes of high quality ground water are unlikely to be encountered in the bedrock at this location.
A poorly permeable soil is likely to be developed on Buck Tongue Member of the Mancos Shale. The
Castlegate Sandstone Member is immediately below the Buck Tongue Member and above the top of the Mancos

Shale, proper. The Buck Tongue Member is sufficiently thick and impermeable as to obviate the need for a pit
liner. A shallow fresh water resource is unlikely to be encountered in the Castlegate Sandstone owing to its

elevated, drained prominence along the line of the Book Cliffs in the area of the proposed location. Poor quality
water is likely to be encountered in permeable Mesozoic and upper Paleozoic sandstones found below the
Mancos Shale. The proposed casing and cementing program should adequately isolate any zones of fresh water
that may be penetrated. No underground and two surface point-to-point water rights have been filed on an area
within a mile of the proposed well site.

Reviewer: Christopher J. Kierst Date: 5/28/2004

Surface:

Proposed location is ~2 miles northeast of Green River, Utah in the Floy Canyon area. Staked location lies north of
I-70 exit 175 about 1.25 miles. Approximately 450' of new access will be built to access this well. There is a 90'
piece of road that will be on BLM surface, for which a right-of-way from the BLM has been initiated. Upgrades to
existing roads will only include cutting both sides of a small wash crossing and installing a culvert. The direct area
drains to the southeast. DWR, SITLA, and Grand County were all invited to attend the pre-drill meeting for this
well, none of whom chose to attend.

Reviewer: Mark L. Jones Date: May 26, 2004

Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to



Muation Ranking Criteria and Ranking re
For Reserve and Onsite Pit Liner Requirements

Site-Specific Factors Ranking Site Ranking

Distance to Groundwater (feet)
>200 0
100 to 200 5
75 to 100 10
25 to 75 15
<25 or recharge area 20 __0

Distance to Surf. Water (feet)
>1000 0
300 to 1000 2
200 to 300 10
100 to 200 15
< 100 20 0

Distance to Nearest Municipal
Well (feet)

>5280 0
1320 to 5280 5
500 to 1320 10
<500 20 0

Distance to Other Wells (feet)
>1320 0
300 to 1320 10
<300 20 0

Native Soil Type
Low permeability 0
Mod. permeability 10
High permeability 20 _ _5

Fluid Type
Air/mist 0
Fresh Water 5
TDS >5000 and <10000 10
TDS >10000 or Oil Base Mud Fluid 15

containing significant levels of
hazardous constituents 20 5

Drill Cuttings
Normal Rock O
Salt or detrimental 10 0

Annual Precipitation (inches)
<10 0
10 to 20 5
>20 10 0

Affected Populations
<10 0
10 to 30 6
30 to 50 8
>50 10

_

_0

Presence of Nearby Utility
Conduits

Not Present 0
Unknown 10
Present 15 0

Final Score 10 (Level III Sensitivity)

Sensitivity Level I = 20 or more; total containment is required.
Sensitivity Level II = 15-19; lining is discretionarv.
Sensitivity Level III = below 15; no specific lining is



STATE OF UTAH, DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS Page 1 of 3

Search Utah.gov

UTAH DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS

WRPLAT Program Output Listing

Version: 2004.03.26.00 Rundate: 05/28/2004 10:09 AM

Radius search of 5280 feet from a point N1110 W495 from the SE corner, section 02, Township 21S, Range 18E, SL
b&m Criteria:wrtypes=W,C,E podtypes=all status=U,A,P usetypes=all (

http://utstnrwrt6.waterrights.utah.gov/cgi-bin/mapserv.exe



STATE OF UTAH, DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS Page 2 of 3

3 2 1 2-591

10 \ 11 12

0 700 1400 2100 2800 Ft

Water Rights

http://utstnrwrt6.waterrights.utah.gov/cgi-bin/mapserv.exe



STATE OF UTAH, DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS Page 3 of 3

WR Diversion Well Status Priority Uses CFS ACFT Owner Name
Number Type/Location Log

Price Field Office USA92-504 Point to Point P 18750000 OS 0.045 0.000 Bureau of Land Management

0 0 12 21S 18E SL 125 South 600 West
Price Field Office USA

92-591 Point to Point P 18750000 OS 0.000 0.000 Bureau of Land Management

0 0 01 21S 18E SL 125 South 600 West

Natural Resources | Contact j Disclaimer | Privacy Policy | Accessibility Policy

http://utstnrwrt6.waterrights.utah.gov/cgi-bin/mapserv.exe



05-04 MSC Cactus Rose 2W
Casing Schematic

Ce « o Surface
TOC @

8-5/8" Surface
MW 8.4 500. MD
Frac 19.3

p‡ aoc s'¯

4 O

5-1/2" Production
MW 9.5 7700.



Well name: 05-04 MSC Cactus Rose 2-1
Operator: MSC Exploration LP
String type: Surface Project ID:

43-019-31402
Location: Grand County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F

Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 72 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimumsection length: 200 ft

Design factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface

Max anticipated surface
pressure: 200 psi

Internal gradient: 0.468 psilft Tension: Non-directionalstring.
Calculated BHP 434 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 7,700 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 9.500 ppg
Neutral point: 437 ft Next setting BHP: 3,800 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 500 ft
Injection pressure 500 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft')
1 500 8.625 24.00 J-55 ST&C 500 500 7.972 24.1

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 218 1370 6.279 434 2950 6.80 12 244 20.33 J

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Phone: 801-538-5281 Date: May 28,2004
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining FAX: 801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 500 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design wi/Ibe thatof the



Well name: 05-04 MSC Cactus Rose 2-1
Operator: MSC Exploration LP
String type: Production Project ID:

43-019-31402
Location: Grand County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 9.500 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F

Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 173 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 368 ft

Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 2,355 ft

Max anticipated surface
pressure: 200 psi

Intemal gradient: 0.468 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 3,800 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 6,591 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (In) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft*)

1 7700 5.5 17.00 N-80 LT&C 7700 7700 4.767 265.3

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 3800 6290 1.655 3800 7740 2.04 131 348 2.66 J

Prepared ClintonDworshak Phone: 801-538-5281 Date: May 28,2004
by: Utah Div. of Oil& Mining FAX: 801-359-3940 Salt Lake City,Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 7700 ft, a mud weight of 9.5 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemier method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of thisdesign wi/Ibe thatof the



Diana Whitney Well 0Iearance Page 1

From: LaVonne Garrison
To: Diana Whitney; Shaver, Monson
Date: 8/19/2004 3:33:43 PM
Subject: Well Clearance

The following well is cleared by SITLA for APD approval purposes

43-019-31402
Cactus Rose MSC 2-1
SESE 2-218-18E

CC: Ed



005
OLENE S. WALKER

Governor

GAYLE F. McKEACHNIE
Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah August 23, 2004

Department of
Natural Resources

ROBERT L. MORGAN
Executive Director MSC Exploration, LP

16800 Imperial Valley Dr., Suite 380
Division of Houston, TX 77060

Oil, Gas & Mining

LOWELL P.BRAXTON
Division airector Re: Cactus Rose MSC 2-1 Well, 1110' FSL, 495' FEL, SE SE, Sec. 2, T. 21 South,

R. 18 East, Grand County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

Appropriate information has been submitted to DOGM and administrative
approval of the requested exception location is hereby granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-019-31402.

erely,

John R. Baza
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Grand County Assessor
SITLA

/
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340•facsimile (801)359-3940• TTY (801) 538-7458 •www.ogm.utah.gov Where ideas



Operator: MSC Exploration, LP

Well Name & Number Cactus Rose MSC 2-1

API Number: 43-019-31402
Lease: ML-47721

Location: SE SE Sec.1 T. 21 South R. 18 East

Conditions of Approval
1. General

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation GeneralRules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following
actions during drilling of this well:

• 24 hours prior to cementing or testing casing
• 24 hours prior to testing blowout prevention equipment
• 24 hours prior to spudding the well
• within 24 hours of any emergency changes made to the approved drilling program

• prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well

The following are Division of Oil, Gas and Mining contacts and their work telephone
numbers (please leave a voice mail message if the person is not available to take the call):

• Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338
• Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284 (spud)

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of

change of plans or other operational actions.

4. Compliance with the State of Utah Antiquities Act forbids disturbance of archeological,
historical, or paleontological remains. Should archeological, historical or paleontological

remains be encountered during your operations, you are required to immediately suspend

all operations and immediately inform the Trust Lands Administration and the Division

of State History of the discovery of such remains.

5. Compliance with the Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill outlined in
the Statement of Basis. (Copy



Page 2
API #43-019-31402
August 23, 2004

6. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns)
have not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the
"Board"). In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the
operator is requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to
analyze geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data
from surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its
analysis, and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon
which the well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate
order from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such
analysis by filing a Request for Agency Action with the



00NFllENTIAL
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: MSC EXPLORATION LP

Well Name: CACTUS ROSE MSC 2-1

Api No: 43-019-31402 Lease Type: STATE

Section 02 Township 21S Range 18E County GRAND

Drilling Contractor BOB BEAMAN RIG # RATHOLE

SPUDDED:
Date 09/09/04

Time 7:30 AM

How DRY

Drilling wi/I commence:

Reported by GAYLIN WILLIAMS

Telephone# 1-713-705-0765

Date 09/13/2004 Signed



'

oo? CONFIDENTIAL
STATE OF UTAH FORM9

DEPAR7MENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DMSION OF OIL,GASAND MINING 5 m ERIALNUMBER:

6. WINDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAME
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS y 4

7. UNITor AGREEMEIVTNAME:
Do not use this funn er proposals ddi newwella signlicanly deepen omlelingwallsbelow cment botarMtolo depih, reenterplugged wegs, orto

drill hodmonlaiinterais. Use APPUCATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLfann forsum proposais.
1. TYPE OFWEU. -- 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER'

OIL WELL GAS WELL L..I OTHER

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR 9. API NUMBER

NSU WK \org on LŸ 9.3 -on-314oc1

3. ADDRESSOFOPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELDANDPOOL.ORWil.DCAT:

4. LOCATIONOF MEU.

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: ) g gg L.-- Ÿ• COUNTY:

QTRJOTR,SECTION, TOWNSHIP,RANGE,MERIDIAN:(gC STATE:
uvAu

n. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXESTO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE,REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O NOTICEOF INTENT
Ao- O DWRN O REPERFORATECURRENTFORMATION

'" O AUTERCASNG FRACTURETREAT SDETMCK TO REPAIR WELL

- O CASINGREPAIR NEW CON5TRUCnON WPORARILY ABAm

a CMNGE TO PREVIOUSPLANS OPERATORCHE TUMNGREMIR

O CMNGE TUB- PLUGAND ABAM VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENTREMT Q CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(siemitoriginalFormo )

O CHANGEWER STATUS PRODUCRON TART&ŒSUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date ofwo =mpleien:

O COMENGLE PRODUCBIGFORMADONS RECLAMATION OF WELLSITE gm

O co--- O RECOMPLETE-OIFFERENTFORMATION

C>O

RECEIVED
SEP1O2004

DVOFOIL,GAS&MNNG

NAME (PLEASEPRINT) N pp 6. TIT1.E VV% e a a a n¾a

SIGNATuRE -r DATE -- - Opg

(TMs speoe for Stain use only)

APPROVED BYTHE STATE
C RSEND OF UTAH OtVISION OF

OIL, GAS AND



INSTRUCTIONS

This form shall be submitted by the operator to show the intention andlor completion of the following:
o miscellaneouswork projects and actions for which other specific report fonns do not exist;
e aU other work and events as identified in section 11, Type of Action, or as required by the Utah Oil and Gas

Conservation General Rules, including:
- minordeepening of an existing well bore,
- plugging back a wel,
- recompleting to a different producing formation within an existingwen bore (intent only).
- reperforatingthecurrent producing formation,
- drilling a sidetrack to repair a well,
- reporting monthly the status of each ddlling wen.

This form is not to be used for oronosals to
- dril new wells,
- reenter previously plugged and abandoned wells,
- significantlydeepen existingwells below their current bottom-hole depth,
- dril horizontal laterals from an existingwell bore,
- dril hydrocarbon exploratoryholes such as core samples and stratigraphictests.

Use Foun 3, Application for Pennit to DrBI(APD) for such proposals.

NOTICE OF INTENT - A notice of intention to do work on a well or to change plans previously approved shall be
submitied in duplicate and must be received and approvedby the division beforethe work is commenced. The operator
is responsible for receipt of the notice by the dMsion in ample timefor proper considerationand action. In cases of
emergency,the operatormayobtainverbal approval tocommencework. Wilhin fivedays afherreceivingverbal approval,
the operatorshall submita Sundry Notice describing the work and acknowledgingthe verbalapproval.

SUBSEQUENT REPORT - A subsequent report shall be submittedto the division within30 days of the completionof
the outlined work. Specino details of the work performed should be provided, including dates, well depths, placement

of plugs, etc.

WELL ABANDONMENT- Proposals to abandon a well and subsequent reports of abandonment should include leasons

for the abandonment; data on any former or present productive zones, or other zones with present significant fluid
contents not sealed offby cement or otherwise;depths (topand bollom) and method of placement of cement plugs;
mud or other material placed below, between and above plugs; amount, size, and method of parting ofany casing, liner,
or tubingpuied and the depth to top of any left in the hole; meihod of closingtop of well; and date wel site conditioned
for final inspection looking toappmval of the abandonment.

Inadditionto any Sundry Notice forms submitted,Form 8, Weil Completion or Recompletion Report and Log must
be submittedto the division to report the rgggia of the fonowing operations:
• completingor plugginga new weit,
• reenteringa previouslyplugged and abandoned well,
• signincantlydeepening an existingwon bore below the current bottom-hole depth,
• driHinghorizontal laterals from an existingwell bore,
• driling hydrocarbon exploratoryholes such as core samples and stratigraphictests,
• recompletingtoa di¾elent producing formation.

Send to:

Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801&3940
Salt Lake City, Utah



09-04 MSC Cactus Rose 2-Jv.
Casing Schematic
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Wellname: 09-04 MSC Cactus Rose 2-1rev.
Operator: MSC Exploration LP
String type: Production Project ID:

43-019-31402

Location: Grand County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 9.500 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F

Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 184 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft

Minimum section length: 368 ft

Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 3,156 ft

Max anticipated surface
pressure: 221 psi

Internal gradient: 0.468 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.

Calculated BHP 4,195 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)

No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)
Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 7,275 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal

Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft3)

1 8500 5.5 17.00 N-80 LT&C 8500 8500 4.767 292.9

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension

Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor

1 ,4195 6290 1.499 4195 7740 1.85 144 348 2.41 J

Prepared Dustin K. Doucet Phone: 801-538-5281 Date: September 15,2004

by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining FAX: 801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah
Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 8500 ft, a mud weight of 9.5 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.

Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop &Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of thisdesign wi/Ibe thatof the



STATEOF UTAH FORM6
DEPARTMEMT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

0 08
ENTITYACTION FORM

Operalot mse . E ½ om \-Ñ Operator Account Number: N 2.'¾ 'i s

stgte T zip , 1 o a <, Phone Number: OR t 43ARS 1 i

Well 1

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Ll3-otA-3WrkÛJ no.tnet, ')-i gE Ä UK Ss'La Úr-RAN£L

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment

Number Number EffecNye Date

Comments:
""" CONRDENT\AL

weilAPI
Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Curmnt EntKy New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number EKoctive Date

Comments:

MAPI
Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment

Number Number Effec6ve Data

Comments:

ACTIONCODES:
A - Establish newentityfor new well(single wellonly)
B - Add new weK to existingendty (groupor unitwell) Name (Piskee P

C - Re-assign well from one existingentity to anotherexistingentity
D - Reessign well fromone existing entity to a new entity signatum
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) RECElVED M- 9 -/<- -o+'

Title Date

SEP18 2m
DIV.0F0tL,GAS&



DNFIDENTIAL
PPI MSC Exploration

Daily Completion Report
Block, Lease and Well No. Contract Riq p_OL DFFil Date on Location Completion Date Report Date

FloyCanyon - State Cactus Rose MSC#2-1 Leed #692 39 39 10/17/2004 Oct 17 2004 Nov 25, 2004

TV_D Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative

6,450 6,450 PSTD $347,000 8,700' Norm Woods

Present Operation Rig Phone: 254-241-5317

Sabbing perfs 6320'- 42' Ríg Fax:

Current Weather j DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP T

Wind: O Yes O No LCSO Sample Date Operator

Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor Ne

Sky: No Pass? Yes Ù No Service

CASINGCRaEsn
ing OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W i 20' 20'

odaccetion 85 8505 TCC 11524
6

825 ' 6
825

BIT, WEIGHT,SPEED AND HfDRAULICSREGORD

BIT Bit Type and Total

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt

Pump
ow Mump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 Pump #3

GPS DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

L gth: Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT

Šmpi F.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PIT #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud Ci Daily Cost Cumulative Cost
$3,723

DIRECTIONAL SU IVEYS
TVD ANGLE Direction Coordinates VS DL CLOSURE

OPERATIONS SU 4MARY

TiiAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0730 1.5 28 WO Crew Time St mmary

0730 0815 28 S Activity Daily Cum.

0815 1045 2.5 21 Unseat packer. POOH standing back. Fluid in 133 rd jt. 2000' of fluid in 1. Mob/DeMob 26

tbg. RU to swab tubingdry. Rec 9 bb1s of acid &dark changing to light 2. Cement 4

water.on first run. LD swab. 3. Circulate 16.5

45 1130 0.8 21 POOH with tubing. 203 jts standing in derrick. LD Hornet packer & SN 4. Directional Work

1Ï30 1230 1.0 28 RU Excell to run CIBP. 5. Drilling 4.5

230 1245 0.3 28 R\H with CIBP Set @6450' KB. (14" long). POOH. LDsetting tool 6. Drive Pipe

1245 1315 0.5 28 PU 4" casing guns. RIH. Perforate 6320' to 6342' (22') w/ .43" holes, 7. Fishing

49.5" penetration. 4 spf, total88 holes. All shots fired 8. OH Lopping

Had 40' of fluid rise following perforating. 9. Lost Circ.

1315 1330 0.3 28 RD Excell. 10. Drill Cmt /LOT

1330 1400 0.5 28 RU to run tubing. PU 1 jt of tubing.Put SN (1.1') then Hornet packer.(8') 11. N.U./ N.D. 5

Installed Washington style stripping head. 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 1

1400 1600 2.0 21 RIH with packer and tubing. Have totalof 197 jts of tubing.(6210') 13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe

Total 6219' KB. Set packer with 20K lbs of tension. 14. R/U; R/D 52.5

1600 . 1615 0.3 28 RU to swab. 15. Rig Repair 1 5

1615 1700 0.8 28 1st swab run. FL= 4400'. (600' of fluid rise after perforating) Rec 6 bbls 16. Run Casing 8.5

black fluid. No gas. No oil 17. Service Rig

2nd run. FL= 5400'. Rec 5 bbis black fluid. No gas No oil 18. Sidetrack Op.

RD swab. SWI. SDFN Total 11 bbls recovered. 19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips 5.25 28.5
22. Tst. BOPs 5
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other 5.75 133.01

Total 11 286.01

Total Hours 11.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious Cost $451,736

Daily Daity Gals Cement: sx ally Cost $12,297

Cum. Cum. 2153 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost $4641035

T 2/3 h/UL' S DECO32004
//3- gjy- 3



oos -CONFIDENTIAL
PPI MSC Exploration

no Daily Completion Report
Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract Rio D.OL ûË& Date on Locatlon Comnietion Date Reoort Date

FloyCanyon - State Cactus Rose MSC#2-1 Leed #692 39 39 10/17/2004 Oct 17, 2004 Nov 25, 2004

MD M Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Compa ly Representative

6,450 6,450 PBTD $347,000 8,700' Norm Woods

Present Ooeration Rig Phone: 254-241-$317 Toolpusher

Sabbing perfs 6320'-42' Rig Fax: AllenCermack

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No LC50Sample Date Operator KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 U Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date ater Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes O No Service KB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth DV Tool MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20' 20'

Surface 8 5/8" 24 KSS STC 12 525' 525' 8.6

Production 5 1/2" 17 LBO LTC 154 6,850' 6,850' 4,270' 4,270' 8.8

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED ANDHiDRAULICS REt ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wi ROT Wt Torque

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 | P_ump #2 Pump #3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15
3/4

LHe
gth: Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm PflMf

PIT

Smpt I-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pii #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud Cl Daily Cost Cumulative Cost
$3,T23

DIRECTIONALSURVEYS
MD

CLOSURE

OPERAT ONS SUL1MARY
Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0730 1.5 28 WO Crew Time SL mmary

0730 0815 0.8 28 Start rig. TP = 10 psi. RU to pull tubing. Activity Daily Cum.

0815 1045 2.5 21 Unseat packer. POOH standing back. Fluid in 133 rd jt. 2000' of fluid in 1. Mob/DeMob 26

tbg. RU to swab tubingdry. Rec 9 bbls of acid & dark changing to light 2. Cement 4

water.on first run. LD swab. 3. Circulate 16.5

iÕ45 1130 0.8 21 POOH withtubing. 203 jts standing in derrick.LD Hornet packer & SN 4. Directional Work

1130 1230 1.0 28 RUExcell to run CIBP. 5. Drilling 4.5

1230 1245 0.3 28 RIH with CIBP Set @6450' KB. (14" long). POOH. LDsettingtool 6. DrivePipe

1245 1315 0.5 28 PU 4" casing guns. RIH. Perforate 6320' to 6342' (22') w/ .43" holes, 7. Fishing

49.5" penetration. 4 spf, total88 holes. All shots fired 8. OH Logging

Had 40'of fluid rise following perforating. 9. Lost Circ.

1315 1330 0.3 28 RD Excell. 10. DrillCmt./LOT

1330 1400 0.5 28 RU to run tubing. PU 1 Jtof tubing.Put SN (1.1') then Hornet packer.(8') 11. N.U./ N.D. 5

Installed Washington style stripping head. 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 1

1400 1600 2.0 21 RIH with packer and tubing. Have totalof 197 jtsof tubing. (6210') 13. P.U./L.D.Pipe

Total 6219' KB. Set packer with 20K lbs of tension. 14. RIU; R/D 52.5

1600 1615 0.3 28 RU to swab. 15. Rig Repair . 1.5

1615 1700 0.8 28 1st swab run. FL= 4400'. (600' of fluid rise after perforating) Rec 6 bbis 16. Run Casing 8.5

black fluid. Nogas. Nooil 17. Service Rig

2nd run. FL= 5400'. Rec 5 bbls black fluid. No gas No oil 18. Sidetrack Op.

RDswab. SWI. SDFN Total 11 bbis recovered. 19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips 5.25 28.5

22. Tst BOPs 5

23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. WellControl
27.WOC
28. Other 5.75 133.01

Total 11 286.01

Total dours 11.0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious Cost $451,736

Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx ailyCost $12,297

Cum. Cum. 2153 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost RCO ye p

DNOF01, GAS&



FPI MSC Exploration
"e * Daily Completion Report

Block Lease and WellNo. Contract Rig Q.QL REg Date enLeêption ComoletionDate Reoort DateFloyCanyon - State Cactus Rose MSC #2-1 Leed #692 38 38 10/17/2004 Oct 17, 2004 Nov 24, 2004MD g Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Compa ty Representative
6,802 6,802 PBTD $347,000 8,700' Norm Woods

Prepent Operation Rig Phone: 254-241-5317 Toolousher
POOH with tubing & packer Rig Fax: AllenGermack

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONSWind: L_]Yes L_) No LC50 $pmplepate operator Ks 15 ftSeas: Problem7 Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date ater Depth ftSky: __I No Pass? O Yes [__INo Service B-CHF
CASINGRECORD

Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth DV Tool MW when LOT
MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20' 20'

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 525' 8.6Production 5 1/2" 17 LSO LTC 154 6,850' 6,850' 4,270' 4,270' 8.8

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HfDRAULICS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg GradeNo Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
Pump

Slow Pump PressuresNo Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 | Pump #2 Pump #3gps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15

1/22 9 x 6 3.15 3/4LHe
gth: Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/MfPIT

Smpi F.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud CompanyPlI

#1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud Cl Daily Cost Cumulative Cost
$3,Ë23DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS

MD TVD ANGLE

OPERATIONS SU.1MARY
iAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:0600 0730 1.5 28 WOcrew

Time St mmary0730 0745 0.3 28 Start rig. TP=0 psi. RU swab Swab perfs 6509 - 18' Activity Daily Cum.0745 0830 0.8 28 ist swab run. FL= 5800', Rec 6 bbis black fluid. No gas 1. Mob/DeMob 260830 0930 1.0 28 LD swab. Halliburtion on location RU Halliburton. Circ 6 % KCL 2. Cement 4Mixing chemicals in 7.5% FE acid. Additives: 2 gal HALH85M,2 gal 3. Circulate 16.5PENN 1085, 2 gals LOURF 300, 50 gals FER Chek ®., 10 gals scale 4. Directional Work
check LP-5S, 5. Drilling 4.50930 1030 1.0 28 Pump treatment down tubing. 2 bpm, Pumped 25 bbis FE acid, Start 6. Drive Pipe
flush of 6 % KCL and ionic wetting agent. 10 bbls of flush pumped 7. Fishingwhen pressure went from 40 psi to 3150 psi. Broke back to 2900 psi 8. OH Logging
increased rate to 6 bpm, pressure 3885 psi. Brokeback to 3750 psi 9. Lost Circ.
and remained there. Total fluid pumped 66 bbis. ISIP 2050 psi. 10. DrillCmt./LOT5 min 1909 psi, 10 min 1863 psi, 15 min 1818 psi,20 mins 1763 psi 11. N.U.I N.D. 525 min 1705 psi, 30 min 1633 psi. RD Halliburton 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 11030 1045 0.3 28 Opened well to pit. Well flowing very slow. Rec 5 bbis water flowing 13. P.U./L.D. Pipe1045 1115 0.5 28 RU swab

14. R/U;R/D 52.51115 1245 1.5 28 Made 4 swab runs. Rec 32 bbis water. 15. Rig Repair 1.51245 1330 0.8 28 Made 2 swab runs. FL= 5700' Rec 10 bbis water and acid mix 16. Run Casing . 8.51330 1430 1.0 28 Made 2 swab runs. FL= 6000' Rec 2 bbls water and acid mix 17. Service RigLight blow of acid gas 18. Sidetrack Op.1430 1500 0.5 28 SWI 19. Stuck Pipe1500 1530 0.5 28 Made 1 swab run. FL= 6300'. Made 4 short runs, No fluid rec 20. Survey1530 1600 0.5 28 SWI
21. Trips 23.251600 1615 0.3 28 Made 1 swab run. FL= 6300'. Made 3 short runs, No fluid rec 22. Tst. BOPs 51615 1645 0.5 28 SWI
23. UR/HO1645 1700 0.3 28 Made 10 th swab run. FL= 6300'. Made 3 short runs. No fluid. 24. W.O.W.Lost sinker bar, mandrel and cups- 25. Wash & ReamTotal fluid recovered = 49 bbis. 17 BLFTR 26. Well ControlSWI SDFN
27. WOC
28. Other 11.01 127.26

Total 11.01 275.01TotaHours 11.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Prevlous Cost $433,608Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $18.128Cum. Cum. 2153 Gals Barite: sx Cum, Cost



DNRDENR
PI MSC Explorationne*A"©' Daily CpjupletionReport

Block. Lease and Well No. ConträttRib 9.96 D.Ëg Date on Location ComoletionDate . Report Date

FloyCanyon - State Cactus Rose MSC#2-1 Leed #692 37 37 10/17/2004 Oct 17, 2004 Nov 23, 2004

m TV_D Footaqe AFE No. AFEAmount Auth.TD. Company Representative

6,802 6,802 PBTD $347,000 8,700' Norm Woods

Present Operption Rig Phone: 254-241-5317 Toolousher

Swabbing Well- Prep to stimulate Rig Fax: Allen Cermack

CurrentWeather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No LCSO Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date Water Depth 11

Sky: O No Pass7 U Yes
_ j No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth DV Tool MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20' 20'

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 525' 8.6

Production 5 1/2" 17 LBO LTC 154 6,850° 6,850' 4,270' 4,270' 8.8

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED AND HIDRAULICSREt,ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No SIze Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROl Wt Tor ue

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pumg#11Pum Plang3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15
1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15
3/4

LHe
gth: Description:

MUD DATA
WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT

Smpi E.L.

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pi l #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 DeslIt MudCI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost
$3,723

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
TVD ANGLE VS

OPERATIONS SUilMARY

Tli)IE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0730 1.5 28 WO Crew
Time St mmary

0730 0745 0.3 28 Start rig. TP= 0 psi, RU 2 7/8" swab

0745 0900 1,3 28 ist swab run. FL=5200'. Rec 6 bbis dark black fluid. No oil. No gas 1. Mob/DeMob 26

2nd run. FL= 6000'. Rec 3 bbis dark black fluid. No oil. No gas 2. Cement 4

3rd run. FL=6100'. Made 3 short runs. Rec 3 bbis dark black fluid. 3. Circulate 16.5

No oil. No gas Solids settle to bottom of jar. Clear water on top 4. Directional Work

0900 0930 0.5 28 SWI for 1/2 hr. 5. Drilling 4.5

0930 1000 0.5 28 4th run. FL= 6200'. No gas. No fluid rec 6. Drive Pipe

1000 1100 1.0 28 SWI for 1 hr. Installed new flags on swab line 7. Fishing

1100 1200 1.0 28 5th run. FL= 6200'. Made short runs for 20 min. No gas. No fluid rec. 8. OH Logging

1200 1330 1.5 28 SWIfor 1.5 hrs. Workedon low spots in road for Halliburton tomorrow 9. Lost Circ.

1330 1400 0.5 28 6 th run. FL= 6100', Made 4 short runs. Rec 1 bbis of black fluid. No gas 10. DrillCmt.lLOT

1400 1500 1.0 26 SWI for 1 hr. Worked on road. 11. N.U./ N.D. 5

1500 1530 0.5 28 7th run. FL = 6200' Made short runs for 20 mins, Rec 1/2 bbi black 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 1

fluid. No gas 13. P.U./L.D. Pipe

1530 1630 1.0 28 SWI for 1 hr. 14. R/U; R/D 52.5

1630 1700 0.5 28 Sth run. FL= 6100'. Made 4 short runs. No gas. Rec 1/2 bbl black fluid 15. Rig Repair 1.5

Laid down swab 16. Run Casing 8.5

SWI SDFN 17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.

Total fluid rec. = 14 bb\s. Fluid samples sent to Larry Moyer 19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips 23.25

22. Tst. BOPs 5

23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. WellControl
27. WOC
28. Other 11 116.25

- =. -.-... - -. -

264

Total dours 11.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board revlous Cost $420,222

Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx ally Cost $13,3

Cum Cum. 2153 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost $433,6po

S AIfE S DECO32004
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PPI MSC Explorationne * Daily Completion Report
Block, l,qqsq and Well No. Contract Riq _DOk 9.Eg Date on Looption Completion Data Report DataFloy Canyon - State Cactus Rose MSC #2-1 Leed #692 36 36 10/17/2004 Oct 17, 2004 Nov 22, 2004MR TV) Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative

6,802 6,802 PBTD $347,000 8,700' Norm Woods
Present Çperation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Swabbing perfs 6509 - 18' Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Allen Cermack

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIGELEVATIONSWind: O Yes U No LC50 Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ftSeas: Problem? O Yes Contractor Next BOPTest Date ater Depth ftSky: U No Pass? O Yes U No Service KB-CHF ftCASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth DV Tool MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20' 20'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 525' 8.6Production 5 1/2" 17 L80 LTC 154 6,850' 6,850' 4,270' 4,270' 8.8

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HiDRAULICS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg GradeNo Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROl Wt Torque

Pump
Slow Pump PressuresNo Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pug#1 Pump #2 Pump #3pps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/22 9 x 6 3.15 3/4
BHA
Length: Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/MfPIT

Smpl I-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer MudCompanyPi #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt MudCI Daily Cost CumulativeCost
$3,123DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS

MD ANGLE VS

OPERATIONS SU.1MARY
¡AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:0600 0600 Shut down for Sunday. Time St mmary

1. Mob/DeMob 26
2. Cement 4
3. Circulate 16.5
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 4.5
6. DrivePipe
7. Fishing
8. OHLopping
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U./ N.D. 5
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 1
13. P.U./L.D.Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 52.5
15. RigRepair 1.5
16. Run Casing 8.5
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips 23.25
22. Tst. BOPs 5
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other 105.25

Total iours Total 253
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $416,812Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $3,410Cum. Cum. 2153 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



T

PPI MSC Exploration CONFllENTIAL- n o* Daily Gompletiowneport
Binck Lease and WellNo Contract Ria ROL OF_Q Date on Loçation ComoletionDate Report Date

FloyCanyon - State Cactus Rose MSC#2-1 Leed #69 35 35 10/17/2004 Oct 17, 2004 Nov 21, 2004

Mg TV__D Footaqe AFQNo. AFE Amount Auth.TD. Company Representative

6,802 6,802 PBTD $347,000 8,700' Norm Woods

Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 olousher

Shut down for Sunday Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 AllenCermack

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: Yes LCSOSample Date Operator RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Ye Contractor Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: Pass? Service RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth DVTool MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20' 20'

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 525' 8.6

Production 5 1/2" 17 L80 LTC 154 6,850' 6,850' 4,270' 4,270' 8.8

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED AND HiDRAUI ICS REGORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

.... ......

.....Manufacturer SerialNumber Jets Depthin Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15
1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15
3/4

BHA
Length: Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm PflMf

PIT

Smpi F.L.

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

.. . .
---.-- - - - - - - -- #1¯ R Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost
$3,)23

DIRECÝIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE Direction Coordinates VS DL CLOSURE

OPERATIONSSU 1MARY
TIME Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0730 1.5 28 WO Crew
Time St mmary

0730 0745 0.3 28 Start rig. TP = 0 psi Activity Daily Cum.

0745 0900 1.3 28 ist swab run FL=5600' (600' fluid rise) Rec 6 bbis black fluid, N 1. Mob/DeMob 26

2nd_run FL= 6100' Made several short runs.Rec 1 bbi black fluid. No & 2. Cement 4

RU rig pump.Mixed 15 gal C19 KCL concentrate and 1 gal ionic wetting 3. Circulate 16.5

agent. Circ H2O ith pump for 1 hr to mix. 4. Directional Work

0900 1000 1.0 2ß SWI for 1 hr. 5. Drilling 4.5

1000 1030 0.5 28 3rd run. FL= 6200' Made short runs for 20 min. Rec 1 bbl black fluid 6. Drive Pipe

Nogas 7. Fishing

1030 1130 1.0 28 SWI for 1 hr. 8. OH Logging

1130 1200 0.5 28 4th run. FL= 6200' Made short runs. No fluid rec No gas 9. Lost Circ.

1200 1300 1.0 28 SWI for 1 hr, 10. DrillCmt./LOT

1300 1330 0.5 28 FL= 6200', Made short runs. No fluid rec. No gas 11. N.U./ N.D. 5

1330 1430 1.0 28 SWI for 1 hr. 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 1

1430 1500 0.5 28 6th swab run. FL= 6200'. Made short runs. No fluid rec. No gas 13. P.U./L.D. Pipe

1500 1630 1.5 28 SWI for 1.5 hr. _ 14. RIU; R/D 52.5

1630 1700 0.5 28 7th run FL- 6100'. Made 3 short runs. Rec small amount black f 1

Nopas. Black settles out to clear water wl 1/2" black solids in bottom of 16. Run Casing 8.5

jar. 17. Service Rig

SW1 SDFN Rec 8 bbis of fluid during day 18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips 23.25

22. Tst. BOPs 5

23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other 11 105.25

Total 11 253

Total Hours 11,0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $409,653

Daily Daily Gals Cement sx DailyCost $7,159

Cum. Cum. 2153 Gals Barite: sx Cum, Cost



MSC Explorationno '
Daily Completion Report

Block Lease png Well No. Contract Rio & _DËâ Date enLeçptien CompletionDate ReDort DateFloy Canyon - State Cactus Rose MSC #2-1 Lead #692 34 34 10/17/2004 Oct 17, 2004 Nov 20, 2004g TVD Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. CompanyRepresentative
6,802 6,802 PBTD $347,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander

Present Çperation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher
Swabbing perfs 6509 - 18' Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONSWind: O Yes O No LC50 Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ftSeas: Problem? O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ftSky: U No Pass? O Yes U No Service RKB-CHF ftCASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts, Run Setting Depth DV Tool MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W i 20' 20'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 525' 8.6Production 5 1/2" 17 L80 LTC 154 6,850' 6,850' 4,270' 4,270' 8.8

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED ANDHYDRAULICSREt,0RD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg GradeNo Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

BitRêmprk;: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt RO1 Wt Torque
Pump

Slow Pump PressuresNo. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 Pump #3gps DC DP TÄ
1 9 x 6 3.15

1/22 9 x 6 3.15
3/4BHA

Length: Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD¾ MBT pH Pm Pf/MfPIT

smpl E.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud CompanyPl f #1 #2 Desand Cent.

Chuck Golightly M-I Dri!!ing Fluids#3 #4 Desilt MudCl Daily Cost Cumulative Cost
DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS

MD

OPERATIONS SUtiMARY
Tli/IE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:0600 0730 1.5 28 WO Crew

Time St mmary0730 0745 0.3 28 Start rig. TP= 0 psi. RU 2 7/8" swab Activity Daily Cum.0745 1000 2.3 28 Ist run. FL=4800'. Rec 6 bbis of black fluid No oil, No gas 1. Mob/DeMob 262nd run FL=5400' Rec 3 bbls black fluid, No gas 2. Cement 43rd run FL=5600' Rec 2 bbis black fluid. Settles out clear water, fines 3. Circulate 16.5on bottom
4. Directional Work4th run FL= 5800', 3 - 1000' short run . No fluid rec. No gas 5. Drilling 4.51000 1100 1.0 28 SWI for 1 hr. 6. Drive Pipe1100 1130 0.5 28 5th run FL=5900' 3 short runs. No fluid rec. No gas 7. Fishing1130 1200 0.5 28 6th run Made short runs for 30 (nins. Rec 1 bbl black fluid. No gas 8. OHLogging1200 1300 1.0 28 SWI for 1 hr.
9. Lost Circ.1300 1330 0.5 28 7th run. FL=6100'. Rec 1 bbi black fluid. No pas. No oil 10. DrillCmt./LOT1330 1430 1.0 28 SWI for 1 hr.
11. N.U./ N.D. 51430 1500 0.5 28 8th run. FL= 6200' Rec no fluid. No gas. 12. P.U./L.O. BHA 11500 1600 1.0 28 SW1for 1 hr.
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe1600 1630 0.5 28 9th run. FL= 6100'. Rec 1 bbl black fluid. No gas 14. R/U; R/D 52.5SWI SDFN
15. RigRepair 1.5
16. Run Casing 8.5Total fluid recovered 14 bbis 17. Service RigManifolded all tanks together (4 tanks) Laid choke ine. 18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe

.- 20. Survey
21. Trips 23.25
22. Tst. BOPs 5
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash &Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other 10.5 94.25

Total dours 10 5 Total 10.5 242
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $402,433Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost

. $7,220Cum. Cum. 2153 Gals Barite: sx Cum, Cost



y

FPI MSC Exploration
n o* Daily Çomplet14tlReport

Block.Lease and Well No. Contract Ria & Of.§. Date on Location Comoletion Date Reoort Date

FloyCanyon - State Cactus Rose MSC#2-1 Leed #692 33 33 10/17/2004 Oct 17, 2004 Nov 19, 2004

MO IV.Q Footage AFE Ng. AF¾ Amognt Auth TD. Company Representative

6,802 6,802 PBTD $347,000 8,700' Carl Huislander

Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Prepare to swab well Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Vislt . NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes U No l,Ç50Sample Dpte Operator RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass7 O Yes O No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth DV Tool MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W i 20' 20'

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 525' 8.6

Production 5 1/2" 17 LBO LTC 154 6,850' 6,850' 4,270' 4,270' 8.8

BIT, WEIGHT,$PEED AND HiDRAULICSRE( ORD

BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 Pump #3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15
3/4

LHe
gth: Description:

MUDDATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm PflMf

PIT

Smpi E.L.

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pf! #1 #2 Desand Cent.
Chuck Golightly M-1Drilling Fluids

#3 #4 Deslit Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost
$3, T23

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE VS

OPERAT ONS SUE1MARY
, 4E Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0730 1.5 28 WO Crew
Time St mmary

0730 0745 0.3 28 _ Start rig RU to swab Activity Daily Cum.

0745 1100 3.3 28 Swab well. Made totalof 18 runs. Rec. 86 bb1s of 6% KCL water. 1. Mob/DeMob 26

Totalbbis rec = 106 bbis FL = 5900' 2. Cement 4

1100 1115 0.3 28 LDswab. RUto pulltubing 3. Circulate 16.5

1115 1245 1.5 21 TOOH with 2 7/8" tubing.standingback 190 jts in derrick 4. Directional Work

1245 1315 0.5 28 RU completion head and stripping head 5. Drilling 4.5

1315 1430 1.3 28 RU Excellperforatinggun. RIH with 4" casing gun. FL=5920' 6, Drive Pipe

Perforated from 6509' to 6518' (9') wl 4 spf. .43" holes, 49.5" penetration 7. Fishing

Allshots fired. Total 36 holes 8. OH Logging

1430 1445 0.3 28 RD Excell 9. Lost Circ.

1445 1500 0.3 28 RU to run 2 7/8" tubing.wlpacker and seating nipple 10. DrillCmt /LOT

1500 1645 1.8 21 PU Baker Homet packer (8.16'), 2 7/8" seating nipple (1.1'). Run 11. N.U./ N.D. 5

on 2 7/8" tubing. Ran 203 jts.Of tubing. End of tubing6400' KB 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 1

SN g 6401' KB. Paker g 6409'. Set packerw/ 20K tension 13. P.U./L,D. Pipe

1645 1700 0.3 28 installed TIW valve w/ 400# gage. SWl. SDFN 14. R/U; RID 52.5

15. Rig Repair 1.5

16. Run Casing 8.5
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips 3.25 23.25

22. Tst. BOPs 5

23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash &Ream
26. WellControl
27. WOC
28. Other 7.75 83.75

Total 1 231.5

Total dours 11.0

Rig Do.vntime Fuel Usage BulkMaterialon Board revious Cost $389,056

Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx ally Cost $13,377

Cum. Cum, 2153 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost $402,433

DEC 3



I MSC Exploration
se$. Daily Completion Report

Block, Lease and Well Ng, Contract Rig ggL QF Date on L9cation ComoletionDate Report DateFloy Canyon - State Cactus Rose MSC #2-1 Leed #692 32 32 10/17/2004 Oct 17, 2004 Nov 18, 2004MD Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representative
6,802 6,802 PBTD $347,000 8,700' Norm Woods

Present Operation Rig Phone: 254-241-5317 Toolpusher
Swabbing wellbore Rig Fax: Allen Cermack

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIGELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LCSO Sample Date Operator 10/22/2004 RKB 15 ftSeas: Problem? O Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ftSky: U No Pass? Yes No Service RKB-CHF ftCASING RECORD

Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn, Jts. Run Setting Depth DV Tool MW when LOT
MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20' 20'

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 525' 8.6Production 5 1/2" 17 L80 LTC 154 6,850' 6,850' 4,270' 4,270' 8.8

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED ANDHiDRAULICS RE4 ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg GradeNo Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wi ROl Wt Tor ue
Pump

Slow Pump PressuresNo. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Purng #1 | Pump Pump #3gps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 1/22 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm P1/MfPIT

Smpl F.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours MudEngineer Mud CompanyPil #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS

OPERATIONS SUitMARY
iAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:0600 0730 1.5 28 WO Crew.

Time Si mmary0730 0900 1.5 15 Started rig. Working on tubingboard. _ Activity Daily Cum.0900 0930 0.5 14 Lay down floor. RU accumulator on BOP 1. Mob/DeMob 260930 1230 3.0 21 TOH with 2 7/8" tubingstanding back. LD BHA (4 - 3.5" DCs, xo, 5.5" 2. Cement 4scraper and 4.75" bit) 3. Circulate 16.51230 1300 0.5 28 RU Excell wireline 4. Directional Work1300 1430 1.5 28 Ran CBL from 6800' to 1910'. Good bond across all potential perfs 5. Drilling 4.5RD Excell 6. Drive Pipe1430 1615 1.8 28 TIH with 2 7/8" tubingwith2 7/8" seating nipple. Tubing @6002' KB 7. Fishing1615 1630 0.3 28 RU 2 7/8" swab. 8. OH Logging1630 1715 0.8 28 Swab well. Swabbing 6% KCL to tank. 3 runs Rec 20 bbls KCL water 9. Lost Circ.FL= 1000'. 10. DrillCmt./LOT1715 1730 0.3 28 LD swab. SWl. SDFN 11. N.U./ N.D. 5
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 1
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 0.5 52.5
15. RigRepair 1.5 1.5
16. Run Casing 8.5
17. Service Rig
18. SidetrackOp.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips 3 20
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. WellControl
27. WOC
28. Other 6.5 76

Total lours 11.5 Total 11.5 220.5
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $374,850Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx DaiÑCost .$14,206Cum. Cum. 2153 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration i \ il
nel Daily Completion Report

Block.Lease andWellNo. 6 I

FloyCanyon - State Cactus Rose MSC#2-1 Leed #692 31 31 10/17/2004 Oct 17, 2004 Nov 17, 2004

MQ Jy_Q Fogiggg R AFEAmoung Auth.TD. Company Representative

6,802 6,802 PBTD $347,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander

Present Ooeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Tonhusher

Prepare to POOH withtubing Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

CurrentWeather DONRVisit NPDES People onLoc.: Last BOPTest Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: Yes No Operator 10/22/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 U Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date Water Depth it

Sky: No Pass7 O Yes No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth DV Tool MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7

Conductor 12-3)4" 24 LP W i 20' 20'

Sulface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 525' 8 6

Production 5 1/2" 17 LBO LTC 154 6,850' 6,850' 4,270' 4,270' 8 8

BIT,W , SP EDANDHY ULICSRE RD

BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer_ Serial Number Jets De th in Foote e Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT.Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Tor ue

Pump
Slow Pum Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum 2 um 3

s DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15

2 9 x 6 3.15
3/4

L gth: | Descr

D DATA

FL Mud Compan
Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud En ineer

Chlorides Ca++
#2 Desand Cent

M-1Drilling FluidsChuck Golightly
Cumulative Cost

#4 Desilt Mud C¡ Dail COst#3

DIRE TIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD ANGL Direction Coordinates VS DL LO URE

OPERATIONS SUMMARY
TIME Time Boats: upply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 1200 6.0 28 WO completion rig
Time Summary

Move in and spot Baker tanks, flat tank and pump. Spot accumulator. Activity Daily m

1200 1500 3.0 14 Mobilize Leed Ri #692 to location. S ot rig. 1. MoblDeMob 26

1500 1700 2.0 14 Ri up completíon rig. Rig u tanks. Start la ing swab flow lines 2. Cement 4

SDFN
3. Circulate 16.5

4. Directional Work
5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging

.. ----

9. Lost Circ.
--

10. Drill Cmt./LOT
11. N.U./ N,D. 5

12. P.U./L.D. BHA
-- 13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe

14. R/U; R/D 5
15. Rig Repair
16. Run Casing 8.5

17. Service Rig
. ---

18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey

172T. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs 5

23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W. -

25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control

---

27. WOC -

28. Other 6 69.5
-

otil (1 209

Total Hours 110
Downtime Fuel Usage BulkMaterial on Board Previous Cost $3

Daily Daily Gals Cement: Daily Cost $3 180

Cum. Cum. 2153 Gals Bari Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Explorationn Daily Completion Report
Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract Rio a .RES Date on Location ComoletionDate . Reoort DateFloy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Unlon #7 20 20 10/17/2004 Oct 17, 2004 Nov 6, 2004Mg Ty_D Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Compa ly Representative

6,802 6,802 PBTD $347,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander
Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Waiting on completion rig Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONSWind: LJ Yes U No LC50 Sample Date Operator 10/22/2004 KB 15 ftSeas: Problem? O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date ater Depth ftSky: O No Pass7 O Yes No Service KB-CHF ftCASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth DVTool MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20' 20'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 525' 8.6Production 5 1/2" 17 L80 LTC 154 6,850' 6,850' 4,270' 4,270' 8.8

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICS RECORD
BIT BitType and Total Avg GradeNo Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets De th in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs ÞU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt To ue
Pump

Slow Pump PressuresNo. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pum #2 Pump #3gps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 1/22 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

LHe
gth: Description:

MUD DATA
WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/MfPIT

Smpi I-.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud CompanyPl Ë #1 #2 Desand Cent.

Chuck Golightly M-I Drilling Fluids
#3 #4 Desilt Mud Cl Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD

OPERATIONS SU;1MARY
iAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:0600 0600 Surveyed access to Cactus Rose 2-1 with BLM,rep. Rich McClureto Time SL mmaryhave rehab areas marked. Two areas were pointed out where trucks Activity Daily Cum.and construction equipment had driven off the traveled road and 1. MoblDeMob 26disturbed the dirt and sagebrush. He requested that we smooth out 2. Cement 4the areas and rebuild theberms. He also requested a short section be 3. Circulate 16.5fenced with steel posts and i strand of smooth wire. Rich was told 4. Directional Workthat MSC would comply. 5. Drilling 4.5

6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U./N.D. 5
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 1
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 47
15. Rig Repair
16. Run Casing 8.5
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips 17
22. Tst. BOPs 5
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash &Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other 63.5

Total 198Total dours
Rig Do.vntime Fuel Usage BulkMaterial on Board Previous Cost $317,703Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $53,967Cum. Cum. 2153 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



J

PPI MSC Exploration
VC

So" Daily ÇQmpletion Report
Block.Leese and WellNo. Contract Rio DOL DEg Date onLocation ComoletionDate Reoort Date

FloyCanyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union#7 10 10 10/17/2004 Oct 17, 2004 Oct 27, 2004

MQ R Footage AFE Ne, AFli Amount Auth.TD. Company Repreyentative

6,802 6,802 PSTD $347,000 8 00' Carl Hulslander

Posent Overation Rlg Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher

Waiting on completionrig Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Wind: O Yes O No LC50Sample Date Operator 10/22/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 U Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass7 Q Yes O No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth DVTool MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

C W 1 20' ii
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 525' 8.6

P chon 5 1/2" 17 LBO LTC 154 6,850' 6,850' 4 270 4,270' 8.8

er Jets Depth In F ge Hrs

Pres

Cum. ROT. Hrs PU W

BHA
Length: Description:

MUD DATA
WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT

smpi EL
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

#1 #2 Desand Cent.
Chuck Golightly M-I Drilling Fluids

#3 #4 Desilt MudC1 Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

D rection Coordinates VS DL CLOSURE

OPERATIONS SUMMARY

TIME Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name Status:

0600 1800 12.0 1 Demobilizing rig off location Time SL mmary
Activity Daily Cum.

9 rig gone. Trash baskets and trailersleft on location 1. Mob/DeMob 12 26

2. Cement 4

T cks released 3. Circulate 16.5

4. Directional Work

Last Report until Completion Rig moves in. 5. Drilling 4.5
--- 6. Drive Pipe

7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.

---- 10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U./ N.D. 5

12. P.U./L.D. BHA 1
---- 13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe

14. R/U; R/D 47

15. Rig Repair
16. Run Casing 8.5

17. Service Rig¯
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips 17

22. Tst. BOPs 5

23. UR/HO
i

24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC

- - - 28. Other ,
63.5

-
- Total 12 198

Total Hours 12.0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage BulkMaterial on Board Prevíous Cost $317,703

Dall Dai Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost

Cum. Cum. 2153 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
4,, Daily Completion Report

BIgçk. Lease an Contract Ria QQL QF,g Date on Location Completionpate Report DateFloy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC #2-1 Union #7 9 9 10/17/2004 Oct 17, 2004 Oct 26, 2004MQ R Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Repreyentative
6,802 6,802 PBTD $347,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander

Presênt Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
DemobilizingUnionRig#7 Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.; Last BOP Test Date RIGELEVATIONSWind: O Yes O No LC50Semple Date Operator 10/22/2004 RKB 15 ftSeas: Problem? O Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ftSky: O No Pass7 O Yes O No Service RKB-CHF ftCASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth DV Tool MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W i 20' 20'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 525' 8.6Production 5 1/2" 17 L80 LTC 154 6,850' 6,850' 4,270' 4,270' 8.8

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICS REt ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total . Avg GradeNo Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets De th In Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
Pump

Slow Pump PressuresNo. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pum 2 Pumpgps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 1/22 9 x 6 3.15 3/4BHA

Length: Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OlL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/MfPIT

smpl E.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud CompanyPl I #1 #2 Desand Cent.

Chuck Golightly M-I Drilling Fluids
#3 #4 Desilt Mud Cl Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

$3,/23DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD

VS CLOSURE

OPERATIONS SUilMARY
TiinE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:0600 1800 12.0 1 Demobilizing rig off location Time SL mmary

Activity Daily Cum.Got 80% of rig moved off location 1. Mob/DeMob 12 14No rain. Road in goodshape. 2. Cement 4
3. Circulate 16.5
4. DirectionalWork
5. Drilling 4.5
6. DrivePipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U./N.D. 5
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 1
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 47
15. RigRepair
16. Run Casing 8.5
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe

: Survey
21. Trips 17
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. WellControl
27. WOC
28. Other 63.5

Total tours 12.0 Total 12 186
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage BulkMaterialon Board Previous Cost $280,051Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $31,892Cum. Cum. 2153 Gals Barite: sx Cum, Cost



CONFIDENTIAL
PPI MSC Exploration

no Daily Completion Report
Black i ease and Well No. Confriót Riq Q_QL Eg Date enLocation ComoletionDate ReportDate

Floy Canyon VŸlldcat - State MSC #2-1 Union #7 8 8 10/17/2004 Oct 17, 2004 Oct 25, 2004
MID M Footaqe AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative

6,802 6,802 PBTD $347,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander
Present Ooeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher

RiggingDown Union Rig #7 Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes No LC50Sample Date Operator 10/22/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? U Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass7 U Yes No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth DV Tool MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20' 20'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 KS5 STC 12 525' 525' 8.6
Production 5 1/2" 17 L80 LTC 154 6,850' 6,850' 4,270' 4,270' 8.8

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB m ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROTWt Torge

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

LHe
gth: Description:

Smpi E.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PI #1 #2 Desand Cent.
Chuck Golightly M-I DrillIng Fluids

#3 #4 Desilt MudCI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost
$3, (23

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD VS CLOSURE

OPERAl lONS SUDIMARY
ME Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0600 24.0 14 Rigging down Union Rig #7 Time St mmary
Dawn Trucking scheduled for Monday moming @0800 Activity Daily Cum.

1. Mob/DeMob 2
2. Cement 4

Light rain all day 3. Circulate 16.5
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 4.5
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U./N.D. 5
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 1
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. R/U; RID 24 47
15. Rig Repair
16. Run Casing 8.5
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips 17
22. Tst. BOPs 5
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other 63.5

Total 24 174
Total iours 24.0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $271,170
Daily Daily 168 Gals Cement: sx DailyCost $8,881
Cum. Cum. 2153 Gats Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration CONFIDENTIAL"ggdaily Completion Report
Block. Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria 09.6 QF.g Date on Location Comoletion Date Reoort Date

Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union#7 4 4 10/17/2004 Oct 17, 2004 Oct 21, 2004

Mg TVJ Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Compa ly Representative

6,802 6,802 PBTD $347,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander

Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toniousher
NU7-1/16" BOP's Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No LC50 Sample Date Operator 1 10/3/2004 KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date ater Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass7 U Yes O No Service 2 11/3/2004 KB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth DVTool MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20' 20'

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' S25' 8.6

Production 5 1/2" 17 LSO LTC 154 6,850' 6,850' 4,216' 4.216' 8.8

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED ANDHIDRAULICS REt.ORD

BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2

Aps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: Description:

MUDDATA
WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm PflMf

PIT
-

Smpi |-.L.

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PIT #1 #2 Desand Cent.
Chuck Golightly M-1Drilling Fluids

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost
$662

DIRECTIONALSU IVEYS
TVD ANGLE Direction Coordinates VS DL CLOSURE

OPERATIONSSUE1MARY
TIME Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 1130 5.5 28 WO completion tools Time Si mmary
¯1130

1400 2.5 28 Rig up power tongs Activity Daily Cum.

1400 2030 6.5 28 PU 2 7/8" tubing.TlH to DV tool. 1. Mob/DeMob 2

2030 2230 2.0 28 TOOH while waiting on bit, scraper and DC's. Stand back tubinq 2. Cement 4

2230 0200 3.5 28 PU 2 7/8" tubing.TIH to DV tool. 3. Circulate 11

0200 0400 2.0 28 TOOH while waiting on bit, scraper and DC's. Stand back tubing 4. Directional Work

0400 0600 2.0 28 NIpple up BOP 5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing

Medium RAIN. Travel willdifficult 8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.

220 2-7/8", 6.5 #lft., NSO,8REUE jtsof tubingon location 10. DrillCmt.lLOT
11. N.U./ N.D. 5

12. P.U./L.D. BHA 1

13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14, R/U; R/D 8
15. Rig Repair
16. Run Casing 8.5

17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips 10.5
22. Tst. BOPs
23. URIHO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other 24 52

Total 24 102

Total dours 24.0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $209,219

Daily Daily 210 Gals ement: sx Daily Cost $16,513

Cum. Cum. 1649 Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Explorationu y Daily Completion Report
Block Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria B _D_FFg Date enLecation ComoletionDate Report Date

Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC #2-1 Union #7 3 3 10/17/2004 Oct 17, 2004 Oct 20, 2004
ID TVD Footage AFE No. AFWAmount Auth. TD. Company Representative

6,802 6,802 PBTD $347,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander
Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher

Prep to PU Bit & Scraper Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIGELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50Sample Dpte Operator 10/3/2004 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date Water Depth it
Sky: O No Pass? O Yes O No Service 11/3/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth DV Tool MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7
Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20' 20'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 525' 8.6
Production 5 1/2" 17 LSO LTC 154 6,850' 6,850' 4,216' 4,216' 8.8

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HiDRAULICS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump PressuresNo. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3
gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

eHnAgth:
Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT

Smpi P.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours MudEngineer Mud Com anyPII #1 #2 Desand Cent.

Chuck Golightly M-I Drilling Fluids
#3 #4 Desilt MudC1 Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

$662DIRECTIONALSURVEYS
MD

OPERAT ONS SUliMARY
ME Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1600 10.0 28 Wait on completion tools Time SL mmary1600 1800 2.0 28 Nipple down wellhead plate. Nipple up Cameron 11', 3M x 7-1/6", 5M Activity Daily Cum.

tubinghead and test to 3,000 psi. 1. Mob/DeMob 21800 0000 6.0 28 Unload tubing,Remove protectors & bands. Stack and strap 2. Cement 40000 0600 6.0 28 Wait on completion tools 3. Circulate 11
4. Directional Work

215 jtsof 2 7/8", 6.5 #lft., NSO,8REUE tbg on location 5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U./ N.D. 5
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 1
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 8
15. Rig Repair
16. Run Casing 8.5
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe .
20. Survey
21. Trips 10.5
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. WellControl
27. WOC
28. Other 24 28

Total 24 78Total iours 24.0
Rig DONntime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $189,045Daily Daily 168 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $20,174Cum. Cum. 1439 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



MPPI MSC Exploration CONFllUlAL
Daily Completion Report

Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria 096 D.Eg Date on Location Completion Date Report Date

Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union#7 2 2 10/17/2004 Oct 17, 2004 Oct 19, 2004

IV_Q Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Comoany Reoresentative

6 802 6,802 PBTD $347,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander

Present Operagen Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Ton1pusher

Prepare to complete well Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No LC50Sample Date Operator 1 10/3/2004 KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date ater Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass? Yes O No Service 2 11/3/2004 KB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth DV Tool MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20' 20'

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 525' 8.6
Production 5 1/2" 17 LOO LTC 154 6,850' 6,850' 4,216' 4,216' 8.8

BIT, WEIGHT,SPEED AND HIDRAULICSREt,0RD

BIT BitType and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks; Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

ggs 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

LHe
gth: Description:

MUD DAÝA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT

kmpi I-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

II #1 #2 Desand Cent.
Chuck Golightly M-I DrillingFluids

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SU IVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE Direction Coordinates VS DL CLOSURE

OPERAT ONS SukiMARY
TI.AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0900 3.0 3 Circulate throughDV tool. Time St mmary

0900 1030 1.5 2 Cement thru DV, Bump plug @3000 psi, 1800 psi over Activity Daily Cum.

pump pressure. Calc displ. 78 bbis, displ with 78 bbis. Tool held 1. Mob/DeMob 2 2

33 bbis cement to pit 2. Cement 2 4

Cmted lead w/ 532 sx - Premium Lite 2, 0.5% static free, 5#/sx CSE 3. Circulate 3 11

.25#lsx cello flake, 3#/sx Kol seal, 6% bentonite,1.5% sodium metasilicate 4. Directional Work

105% water 5. Drilling

Tall wl 78 sx - 50-50 Poz, Class G, wl .05% static free, 3% CaCI, 6. Drive Plpe

1/4#/sx cello flake, 4#lsx kol seal, .5% FL52, .002 gallsx FP-6L, 7. Fishing

2% bentonite, 51.9% water. Yield 1.26 gallsx 8. OHLogging

1030 1100 0.5 2 Rig down BJ 9. Lost Circ.

1100 1200 1.0 11 Nipple down BOP. Set slips in full tension. 102000 lbs 10. DrillCmt./LOT

1200 2000 8.0 14 Change pipe rams, dump and clean pits 11. N.U./ N.D. 5 5

2000 2300 3.0 28 Set pipe racks for DCs inspection 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 1

2300 0300 4.0 11 Remove BOP from substructure 13. P.U./L.D. Pipe

0300 0400 1.0 28 Set up racks for tubingdelivery 14. R/U; R/D 8 8

0400 0600 2.0 1 Rig down mud cleaning equipment for move 15. Rig Repair
16. Run Casing 8.5
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips 10.5
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. We11Control
27. WOC
28. Other 4 4

Total 24 54

Total iours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulkMaterial on Board Previous Cost $118,092

Daily Daily 252 Gals ement: sx Daily Cost $70,953
Cum. Cum. 1271 Gals ar¡te: sx Cum. Cost



PI MSC Explorationno ' Daily Completion Report
Block, Lease and Well No. Contract Ria g QEg Date on Location Completion Dgte Report Date

Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union #7 1 1 10/17/2004 Oct 17, 2004 Oct 18, 2004
MD TV_D Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representative

6,850 6,850 TD $347,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander
Present Queration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Circulating through DV tool Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: Yes O No LC50 Sample Date Operator 10/3/2004 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem7 U Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? O Yes O No Sentice 11/3/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 8.6
Production 5 1/2" 17 LSO LTC 154 6,850' 8.8

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED AND H TDRAULICS REt ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets De th in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM #1 Pug Pum_g#3

gps DC DP 1/4
1 9x6 3.15 120 378 1000 194 379 207 1/2
2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

OHA
Length: 578.85' Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT 8.8 57 13 19 10/37 6.2 2 4.3 tr 10 10 0.5 .4/.6

Smpl E.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud CompanyPlË #1 #2 Desand Cent.

Chuck Golightly M-I Drilling Fluids
#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost CumulativeCost

$A60 $662DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD

OPERATIONS SUL1MARY
.AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0000 0200 2.0 3 Circulate and condition Time St mmary0200 0800 6.0 21 Pump pill, TOOH Iaying down drill pipe Activity Daily Cum.0800 0900 1.0 12 Lay down BHA. Pull wear bushing 1. MoblDeMob0900 1130 2.5 16 Rig up T &MCasing Crews. Change out pipe rams 2. Cement 2 21130 1200 0.5 16 Run casing to 500', 3. Circulate 6.5 81200 1730 5.5 16 Run casing to 6850'. 154 jts,5 1/2" 17#lFT, LTC, LSOcasing 4. Directional Work
Centrilizers- (29) - 6803', 6755', 6664', 6530', 6444', 6306', 6261', 5. Drilling
612T, 6038', 5902', 5771', 5635', 5547', 5455', 5065, 4934', 4890', 4665', 6. Drive Pipe
4620', 4576', 4486', 4264', 4172', 4080', 4035', 441', 305', 169', 80' 7. Fishing
DV tool@4216' 8. OH Logging1730 2100 3.5 3 RD casers. Circulateand condition hole whileBJ rigs up. 9. Lost Circ.2100 2300 2.0 2 Cementing with BJ. Plug down at 0445 hrs. Bumped plug at 1820 psi 10. Drill Cmt./LOT
600 psi over. Calc displacement 157.8, displaced with 157 bbis 11. N.U./N.D.
Float held- 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 1 1

Cemented w/ 490 sx - 50-50 Poz, Class G, w/ .05% static free, 3% CaCI, 13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
1/4#lsx cello flake, 4#lsx kol seal, .5% FL52, .002 gallsx FP-6L, 14. R/U;R/D
2% bentonite, 51.9% water. Yield 1.26 gallsx 15. Rig Repair2300 0000 1.0 3 Open DV toot Circulate throughDV tool. 16. Run Casing 8.5 8.5

17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.

Rain created road conditions that required a dozer and road grader 19. Stuck Pige
to bring in water and BJ trucks. Raining & snowing in area. 20. $urvey

21. Trips 6 10.5
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other

Total lours 24.0 Total 24 30
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $6,248Daily Daily 924 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $111,844Cum. Cum. 1019 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



. CONFilENRMPPI MSC Exploration
/W> Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract Rio .ORL RE§. Date on Location Soud Date Report Date

Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC #2-1 Union #7 40 38 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Oct 17, 2004

MQ TV_D Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth.Tp. Compa ty Representative

6,850 6,850 $937,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present ODefallOn Rig Phone: 436-220-0999 Toolpusher

Circulating & conditioningmud Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 19 ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes No I.CSC Sample Date Operator 3 10/3/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: No Pass7 U Yes _jNo Service 5 11/3/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth LinerTop MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'

Surface 8 5/8" 24 KSS STC 12 525' 8.6

BIT,WEIGHT, SPEED ANDHIDRAULICSREØORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

3rr 7 7/8 Smith ER7031 MW4779 Open

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump # Pumg P

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 120 378 1000 194 379 207 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 578.85 Description: bit, 12 - DC 6 1/4" (335.13'),1- 6 1/4" jars(36.22'), 6- 61/4" DC (206.54')

Smpi |-.L.

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PU 10000 80 86 86 #1 #2 Desand Cent.

2 % KCL 145 145 24 Chuck Golightly M-I Drilling Fluids

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

145 255 24 $Abu 68,104

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
TVD

OPERATIONS SU.1MARY
T1iAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0630 0.5 8 RU Halliburton logs. Time St mmary

0630 2330 17.0 8 Log well Activity Daily Cum.

2330 0430 5.0 21 RD loggers. TlH 1. MoblDeMob 33

0430 0600 1.5 3 Circulate and condition hole 2. Cement 2.5
3. Circulate 1.5 17.5
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 212.25
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing 9

WH:FIVFD 8.OHLogging 17.5 18
9. Lost Circ.

12. P.U./L.D. BHA 5

DlvOF01, M MINING 13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 3

Buck Tongue - O' Castlegate 65' 15. Rig Repair 27.5

Mancos Shale - 296' Dakota Silt 3872' 16. Run Casing 2.5

Dakota Sandstone 4062' Morrison (Brushy Basin) 4164' 17. Service Rig 4.5

Morrison (Salt Wash) 4534' Moab Tongue 4926' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Entrada 5087' Carmel 5429' 19. Stuck Pipe

Navajo 557T Wingate6330' 20. Survey 8.75

Chinie 6664' 21. Trips 5 55

Probable fault lower Wingateor top of Chinie 22. Tst. BOPs 5.5
23. UR/HO

BG = u 24. W.O.W.

CG = u 25. Wash & Ream 2.5

TG = n/a u 26. Well Control

Max FG = u 27. WOC
28. Other 50

Total 24 468
Total dours 24.0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage BulkMaterial on Board revlous Cost $559,333
Daily Daily 378 Gals Cement: sx allyCost $46,903
Cum. Cum. 10490 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration' Daily Drilling Report
Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria & _Qf Date on I ocation SDud Date Report Date

Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union#7 39 37 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Oct 16, 2004m Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth.TD. Company Representative
6,850 6,850 141 $937,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Operation RIg Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolpusher
TOH for logging Rig Fax: 436-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 15 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LCSOSample Date Operator 1 10/3/2004 RKB 15 11
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: O No Pass? O Yes O No Service 3 11/3/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W i 20'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 8.6

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICS RE( ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP footh Bearing Gage
3rr 7 7/8 Smith ER7031 MW4779 16,16,16 6,556' 1,222' 68 1/2 30/38 30/40 17.8 7 5 1/8

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt RO I Wt Torque
198.) b 142 122 132

Pump Slow Pump PressuresNo. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 | Pump #2 Pump #3
gps DC DP 1/4

1 9x6 3.15 120 378 1500 194 379 207 1/2 62 380
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 606.44 Description: bit, 1- mud motor (27.59')

12 - DC 6 1/4" (335.13'),1- 6 1/4" jars(36.22'), 6- 61/4" DC (206.54')
Mud motor .24* 378 gpm = 91 rpm, + 40 rot table = 131 rpm on bit

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT 8.9 55 13 18 12/36 6,2 2 4.3 10 10 0.6 .5/.7

Smpi |-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud CompanyPS 10000 80 91 91 #1 #2 Desand Cent.

2 % KCL 145 145 Chuck Golightly M-I DrillingFluids
#3 #4 Desilt MudCI DailyCost CumulativeCost
145 255 $6,003 $9,654

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD VS CLOSURE

6790 6790 4,00 °

OPERATONS SUE1MARY
TilAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1200 6.0 5 Drill6709' to 6771' Time St mmary1200 1230 0.5 17 Service rig Activity Daily Cum.1230 2000 7.5 5 Drill to 6850' 1. MoblDeMob 332000 2100 1.0 3 Circulate bottoms up 2. Cement 2.52100 2230 1.5 21 Short trip. 20 stands, no drag, hole in goodshape 3. Circulate 3 162230 0000 1.5 3 Circulate and condition mud for logs 4. DirectionalWork0000 0030 0.5 3 Pump pill 5. Drilling 13.5 212.250030 0100 0.5 20 Drop survey - 6790 - 4 deg 6. Drive Pipe0100 0530 4.5 21 TIHfor logs 7. Fishing 90530 0600 0.5 8 RUHalliburton loggers 8. OH Logging 0.5 0.5

9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt/LOT 1.5
11. N.U./N.D. 10
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 5
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. RIU; RID 3

Buck Tongue - O' Castlegate 65' 15. Rig Repair 27.5
Mancos Shale - 296' Dakota Silt 3872' 16. Run Casing 2.5
Dakota Sandstone 4062' Morrison (Brushy Basin) 4164' 17. Service Rig 0.5 4.5
Morrison (Salt Wash) 4534' Moab Tongue 4926' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Entrada 5087' Carmel 5429' 19. Stuck Pipe
Navajo557T Wingate 6330' 20. Survey 0.5 8.75
Chinie 6664' 21. Trips 6 50
Probable fault lower Wingate or top of Chinie 22. Tst. BOPs 5.5

23. UR/HO
BG = 12 u 24. W.O.W.
CG = 13 u 25. Wash & Ream 2.5TG = na u 26. Well Control
Max FG = 16 u 27. WOC
No new shows 28. Other 50

Total 24 444Total 10urs 24.0
Rig Do.vntime Fuel Usage BulkMaterial on Board Previous Cost $530,867Daily Daily 924 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $28,466Cum. Cum. 10112 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



MPPI MS0 Exploration
ne

ggy Daily Drilling Report
Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract Rio 206 REg Date on Location Soud Date Report Date

FloyCanyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union#7 38 36 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Oct 15, 2004

MR TV__Q Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth.TD. Compa ty Representative

6,709 6,709 153 $937,000 8,500' Carl Huistander

Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 ToOIDusher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 16 ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes M No LC50Sample Date Operator 2 10/3/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 O Yes Contractor 11 ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass7 O Yes No Service 3 11/3/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W i 20'

Sulface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 8.6

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED AND HIDRAULICSREt ORD

BIT Bít Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

3rr 7 7/8 Smith ER7031 MW4779 16,16,16 6,556' 1,081' 55 30 40 19.7

BitBenlarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

198.c 141 120 130

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Le_ump_4_2_Pump na
gps DC DP 1/4

1 9x6 3.15 120 378 1460 194 379 207 1/2 62 360

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA

ILength: 606.44 Description: bit, 1- mud motor (27.59')
12 - DC 6 1/4" (335.13'),1-6 1/4" jars(36.22'), 6- 61/4" DC (206.54')

Mudmotor .24* 378 gpm = 91 rpm, + 40 rot table = 131 rpm on bit

MUDDATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT 8.8 44 11 13 8/26 6.0 2 3.5 TR 10 11 1.5 1.1/1.5

Smpi |-.L.

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pl 10000 80 89 89 #1 #2 Desand Cent.

2% KCL 145 145 24 Chuck Golightly M-I Drilling Fluids

#3 #4 Desilt MudCl Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

145 255 24 $3,062 $61,651
DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS

MD
6577 6577 2.25 *

OPERATONS SU.tMARY
¡A Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0900 3.0 7 TOOH with fishing tools Time St mmary

0900 1000 1.0 7 Lay down fishing tools Activity Daily Cum.

1000 1100 1.0 17 Service rig, Repair U joints 1. Mob/DeMob 33

1100 1430 3.5 21 TIH with RR #3 bit 2. Cement 2.5

1430 1530 1.0 15 Repair hydromatic 3. Circulate 2.5 13

1530 1730 2.0 21 TIH. Load pipewithmud 4. Directional Work

1730 1900 1.5 3 Circulate 5. Drilling 9.5 198.75

1900 2000 1.0 3 Work bit around junk 6. Drive Pipe

2000 0130 5.5 5 Drill6556' to 6649' 7. Fishing 4 9

0130 0200 0.5 20 Survey 6577' - 2.25 deg 8, OH Logging

0200 0600 4.0 5 Drill6649' to 6709' 9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 1.5

Contacted by Rich McClure,BLM, He stated that we had complied with 11. N.U./ N.D. 10

courtesy citation. He futher stated that we would communicatie next week 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 5

regarding using some of our eg. to removetrucktire tracks we created 13. P.U,lL.D. Pipe

off of the maintraveled portion of the road. 14. R/U; R/D 3
15. Rig Repair 1 27.5
16. Run Casing 2.5

Buck Tongue -0' Castlegate 65' 1T. Service Rig 1 4

Mancos Shale -296' Dakota Silt 3872' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Dakota Sandstone 4062' Morrison (Brushy Basin) 4164' 19. Stuck Pipe

Morrison (SaltWash) 4534' MoabTongue 4926' 20. Survey 0.5 8.25

Entrada 5087' Carmel 5429' 21. Trips 5.5 44

Navajo 5577' Wingate 6290' 22. Tst. BOPs 5.5

RECHvgD 23.UR/HO

BG= 8 u 24. W.O.W.

CG = 10 u 25. Wash & Ream 2.5

TG * 26 u 26. Well Control

Max FG = 15 u 27. WOC

No new shows 28. Other 50
Total 24 420

Total lours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board revious Cost $509,903

Daily Daily 588 Gals Cement: sx ailyCost $20,964
Cum. Cum. 9188 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost



PPI MSC Explorationne * Daily Drilling Report
ßloçk,Lease and Wall No. Contract Ria g _DË& Date on Location SDUd Date Report Date

Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union #7 37 35 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Oct 14, 2004
I TV__D Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative

6 556 6,556 $937,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander
Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

TOOH with fishing tools Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 16 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50Sample Date Operator 2 10/3/2004 KB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 NextBOP Test Date ater Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? O Yes O No Service 3 11/3/2004 KB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 8.6

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HiDRAULICS REt.ORD
BIT BitType and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets De th in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
5 7 7/8 Hughes GX20 5054763 16,16,16 5,624' 932' 38 1/2 20/35 45/55 24.2 8 8 O

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROI Wt Torque
$89.26 147 113 133

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pump #3

gps 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 120 378 850 194 379 207 1/2 62 400
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 585.44 Description: 1 globe basket (4.08'), i boot (junk)basket (3.35'), junk basket (2.07'), bit sub (3.24',

12 - DC6 1/4" (335.13'),1- 6 1/4" jars(36.22'), 6- 61/4" DC (206.54')
Mud motor .24* 378 gpm = 91 rpm, + 50 rot table = 141 rpm on bit

Šmpl E.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pf! 10000 80 90 90 #1 #2 Desand Cent
2% KCL 145 145 24 Chuck Golightly M-I DrillingFluids

#3 #4 Deslit Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost
145 255 24 41,$i4 48,699

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD ANGLE CLOSURE

OPERATIONSSUMMARY
ME Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0800 2.0 21 TOOH, Chained out. Drive line broke. Lost 2 cones Time St mmary
0800 1700 9.0 15 Rig repair. Repair right drive line, fix oil leaks. Activity Daily Cum.
1700 1800 1.0 21 PU fishing tools, globe and 2 junk baskets 1. Mob/DeMob 33
1800 2230 4.5 21 TlH 2. Cement 2.5
2230 0330 5.0 7 Fishing for cones. Pump pill. 3. Circulate 10.5
0330 0600 2.5 21 TOOH 4. Directional Work

5. Drilling 189.25
6. Drive Pipe

Pipe tubs and construction equipment removed from the area 7. Fishing 5 5
Attempted to contact, Rich McClure BLM office. Out for 2 days. Willtry 8. OH Logging
again 10/14/04. 9. Lost Circ.

10. DrillCmt./LOT - 1.5
11. N.U./ N.D. 10
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 5
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; RID 3

Buck Tongue - O' Castlegate 65' 15. Rig Repair 9 26.5
Mancos Shale -296' Dakota Silt 3872' 16. Run Casing 2.5
Dakota Sandstone 4062' Morrison (Brushy Basin) 4164' 17. Service Rig 3
Morrison (Salt Wash) 4534' Moab Tongue 4926' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Entrada 5087' Carmel 5429' 19. Stuck Pipe
Navajo 557T Wingate 6290' 20. Survey 7.75

21. Trips 10 38.5
22. Tst. BOPs 5.5
23. UR/HO

BG = u 24. W.O.W.
CG = u 25. Wash & Ream 2.5
TG = u 26. Well Control
Max FG = u 27. WOC

28. Other 50
Total 24 396Total lours 24.0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $475,823Daily Daily 588 Gals Cement sx Daily Cost $34,080Cum. Cum. 8600 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



MPPI MSC Exploration CONFllENTIAL
'gy Dailyþrilling geport

Block,Lease andWellNo. CöntáctRIa a D.Eg Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

FloyCanyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union#7 36 34 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Oct 13, 2004

MI.D TV_J) Footage AFSNo. AFEAmount Auth.TD. Company Representative

6,556 6,556 275 $937,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Ooeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

TOOH Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 conradTenney

CurrentWeather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: U Yes No LC50 Sample Date Operator 1 10/3/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: No Pass? U Yes UNo Service 2 11/3/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W i 20'

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 8.6

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICSREt ORD

BIT BítType and Totaf Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

5 7 7/8 Hughes GX20 5054763 16,16,16 5,624' 932' 38 1/2 20/35 45/55 24.2

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

116.fa 14) 123 133

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1) Pum Pump #3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9x6 3.15 120 378 1550 194 379 207 1/2 62 400

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 606.44 Description: bit, 1- mud motor (27.59'), 1-6 1/4" DC (30.82'), 10 - DC 6 1/4" (302.16')

1- 6 1/4" jars(36.22'), 7- 61/4" DC (208.65')
Mud motor .24* 378 gpm = 91 rpm, + 50 rot table = 141 rpm on bit

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm PflMf

PIT 8.8 44 11 14 8/24 6.0 2 3.5 tr 10 11.2 1.6 1.3/1.8

smpi I-.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

H 10200 80 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2.1% KCL 180 180 24 Chuck Golightly M-I Drilling Fluids

#3 #4 Desilt MudCI DailyCost Cumulative Cost

180 255 24 $12,301 $4),425

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD

CLOSURE

6272 6272 2.50 °

OPERAT ONS SUMMARY
alE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0900 3.0 5 Drill6281' to 6342' Time St mmary

0900 0930 0.5 20 Survey 6272' - 2.5 deg Activity Daily Cum.

0930 1000 0.5 17 Service rig 1. Mob/DeMob 33

1000 0130 15.5 5 Drill6342 to 6556' 2. Cement 2.5

0130 0230 1.0 3 Circ. Mix and pump pill 3. Circulate 1 10.5

0230 0600 3.5 21 TOOH to 1029'. Right drive line broke. Willchain out of hole 4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 18.5 189.25

BLMRanger, Jon Sering, came to location. Disturbed sage brush areas, 6. Drive Pipe

where we had parked 3.5" DP tubs, wil!require reseeding and the tubs 7. Fishing

removed. Jon was toldthat we would comply. Thisarea had been 8. OH Logging

disturbed orginallyby Neilson Construction when building the location. 9. Lost Circ.

We used same area due to shortage of space on Cactus Rose 2-1, in 10. DrillCmt./LOT 1.5

in Blaze Canyon. Tubs willbe moved and stored on MSC 35-1 temporarily 11. N.U./ N.D. 10

BLM,Rich McClure 435-259-2100, is to be contacted for reseeding inst. 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 5
13. P.U.IL.D. Pipe

Buck Tongue - 0' Castfegate 65' 14. R/U; R/D 3

Mancos Shale -296' Dakota Silt3872' 15. Rig Repair 17.5

Dakota Sandstone 4062' Morrison (Brushy Basin) 4164' 16. Run Casing 2.5

Morrison (Salt Wash) 4534' Moab Tongue 4926' 17. Service Rig 0.5 3

Entrada 5087' Carmel 5429' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Navajo 5577' Wingate 6290' 19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey 0.5 7.75

Show # 5a 5960' to 6220' (60') yellow flour, see oíl on samples 21. Trips 3.5 28.5

Show #6 6090' to 6250' (160') yellow flour, see oil on samples 22. Tst. BOPs 5.5

Show #7 6330' - 6379', (40') lite brown oil coming out of samples 23. UR/HO

BG = 7 - 12 u 24. W.O.W.

CG = 2 - 3 u 25. Wash & Ream 2.5

TG=0u L CEIVEU 26. Well Control

Max FG = 0 u 27. WOC

Total of shows = 260 DEC19 2004 26 °'"'' 6°
Total 24 372

Total lours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuet Usage Bulk Material on B U^6 RMNG Previous Cost $392,454

Daily Daily 711 Gals Cement: sx DailyCost $83,369

Cum. Cum. 8012 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Explorationn o* Daily Drilling Report
Block. Lease and WellNo. Contraçt Riq ûQL Ë& Date on Locatlon Soud Date Report Date

Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union#7 35 33 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Oct 12, 2004
MD Ty Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representative

6,281 6,281 657 $937,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander
Present Qgeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Drilling Rig Fax; 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: Yes O No LCSOSample Date Operator 1 10/3/2004 KB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date ater Depth 11
Sky: Ü No Pass? O Yes O No Service 2 11/3/2004 KB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 8.6

BIT, WEIGHT,SPEED AND HIDRAULICS REt ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
5 7 7/8 Hughes GX20 5054763 16,16,16 5,624' 657' 20 16/35 45/55 32.9

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pump #1 Pum #2 Pump #3

ggs DC DP 1/4 48 350
1 9x6 3.15 120 378 1550 144 379 209 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 606.44 Description: bit, 1- mud motor (27.59'), 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.82'), 10 - DC 6 1/4" (302.16')

1- 6 1/4" jars(36.22'), 7- 61/4" DC (208.65')
Mud motor .24* 378 gpm = 91 rpm, + 50 rot table = 141 rpm on bit

M

Smpi E.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

P 10000 80 90 90 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
180 180 24 Chuck Golightly M-1DrillingFluids
#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost
180 245 24 $8,/86 Š3U,124

DIRECTIONAL SURVEY$
MD TVD ANGLE VS CLOSURE

5788 5788 1.75

OPERAT ONS SUE1MARY
iŒ Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0700 1.0 21 TIH with Bit #5. Time SL mmary
0700 0730 0.5 3 Load hole &circulate out gas @3726' Activity Daily Cum.
0730 0830 1.0 21 TIH with Bit #5. 1. Mob/DeMob 33
0830 0900 0.5 5 Drilling 5625 to 5848' 2. Cement 2.5
0900 1000 1.0 20 Circ. Bottoms up. Run survey 5788. 3. Circulate 0.5 9.5
1000 1030 0.5 17 Service rig. 4. Directional Work
1030 0130 15.0 5 Drillingfrom 5848 to 6281'. 5. Drilling 15.5 170.75

6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt]LOT 1.5
11. N.U./N.D. 10

Buck Tongue -0' Castlegate 65' 12. P.U./L.D. BHA 5
Mancos Shale -296' Dakota Silt 3872' 13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
Dakota Sandstone 4062' Morrison (Brushy Basin) 4164' 14. R/U;R/D 3
Morrison (Salt Wash) 4534' Moab Tongue 4926' 15. Rig Repair 17.5
Entrada 5087' Carmel 5429' 16. Run Casing 2.5
Navajo 5577' 17. Service Rig 0.5 2.5

18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey 1 7.25

BG = 7 - 14 u 21. Trips 2 25
CG = 2 - 3 u 22. Tst. BOPs 5.5
TG = 45 u 23. UR/HO
Max FG = 0 u 24. W.O.W.
Comments: Oil seen in the samples with naked eye @5311-5388'. 25. Wash & Ream 2.5
Correct footage on Show #5 is 5087-5540 = 453' 26. Well Control

27. WOC
28. Other 50

Total 19.5 348
Total iours 19.5

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $365,591
Daily Daily 798 Gals Cement sx Daily Cost $26,863Cum. Cum. 7301 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PI MSC Exploration
ne*|*©' Daily OrillingReport

Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract RIa QQL DEâ, Date on Location Soud Date Recolt Date

FloyCanyon Wildcat- State MSC#2-1 Union#7 34 32 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Oct 11, 2004

MD M Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TO. CompanY Representative

5,624 5,624 217 $937,000 8,500' Carl Hulslander

Present Ooeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

T1Hwl new bit Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

CurrentWeather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 aat BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes No LCSOSample Date operator 1 10/3/2004 KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 ext BOP Test Date ater Depth ft

Sky: O No Pass? O Yes O No Service 2 11/3/2004 KB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW \ Leakoff?

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 8.6

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED ANDHfDRAULICSREt,ORD
BIT BitType and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

4 7 7/8 Reed HP 51A H38229 16,16,16 4,776' 848' 48 2/30 45/55 17.7 5 4 1/16

5 7 7/8 Hughes GX20 5054763 16,16,16 5.624'

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt RO1 Wt Torque

118.26 124 110 152
Pu p.

Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV

gs DC DP 1/4 47 240

1 9 x 5.5 2.64 120 378 1350 193 378 207 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15
3/4

BHA
Length: 606.44 Description: bit, 1- mud motor (27.59'), 1-6 1/4" DC (30.82'), 10 - DC 6 1/4" (302.16')

1- 6 1/4" jars(36.22'), 7- 61/4" DC (208.65')
Mudmotor .24* 378 gpm = 91 rpm, + 50 rot table = 141 rpm on bit

MUD DATA

WT, VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT 8.9 42 11 13 8/24 7.2 2 4.3 tr 10 11 1.5 1.2/1.8

smpi I-.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PI 10000 80 92 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2% KCL 180 180 24 Chuck Golightly M-1Drilling Fluids

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

180 245 24 $6,640 $21,33!!
DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS

MD TVD
CLOSURE

OPERATIONS SU IMARY
AL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 1800 12.0 5 Drill5407' to 5609' Time St mmary

1800 1930 1.5 5 Drillto 5619' - String torqueingand pulling 20 - 40Kover Activity Daily Cum.

1930 2200 2.5 5 Drilland Circulate 5619' to 5624'. Working on drilling rate. MudWt. 1. MoblDeMob 33

inc to 9 and vis dropped to 35. Changed shaker screens to 180 2. Cement 2.5

Cleaned and checked Mud cleaner 3. Circulate 1 9

2200 2300 1.0 3 Mixand pump pill 4. Directional Work

2300 0300 4.0 21 TOOH 5. Drilling 16 155.25

0300 0400 1.0 21 PU bit #5, Lay down stabilizers 6. Drive Pipe

0400 0600 2.0 21 TlH 7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 1.5

11. N.U.I N.D. 10
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 5

13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 3

Buck Tongue - 0' Castlegate 65' 15. Rig Repair 17.5

Mancos Shale -296' DakotaSilt3872' 16. Run Casing 2.5

DakotaSandstone 4062' Morrison(BrushyBasin)4164' 17. Service Rig 2

Morrison (Salt Wash) 4534' Moab Tongue 4926' 18. Sidetrack Op.

Entrada 5087' Carmel 5429' 19. Stuck Pige

Navalo 557T 20. Survey 6.25

21. Trips 7 23

22. Tst. BOPs 5.5

23. UR/HO

BG = 7 - 14 u 24. W.O.W.

CG =2-3u RECH VED 25.Wash&Ream 2.5

TG = 0 u 26. Well Control

Total 24 328.5

Total dours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious Cost $333,696

Daily Daily 1000 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $31,895

Cum. Cum. 6503 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
"c

'
Daily Drilling Report

Black Lease and Well No ÇontractRiq QQ.L M Datê enLocêtien Saud Date Report Date
Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC #2-1 Union #7 33 31 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Oct 10, 2004

Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representative
5,407 5,407 457 $937,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander

Present ODeration RIg Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher
Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes M No LC50Sample Date Operator 1 10/3/2004 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: O No Pass? O Yes No Service 2 11/3/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 8.6

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HiDRAULICS RELORD
BIT BIt Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
4 7 7/8 Reed HP 51A H38229 16,16,16 4,776' 631' 32 15/30 45/55 19.7

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
116.ib 124 100 1$2

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pump #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4 47 240
1 9 x 5.5 2.64 120 378 1350 193 376 207 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 615.57 Description: bit, 1- mud motor (27.59'), 1-IBS (4.93)- 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.82'), 1 IBS (4.20'), 10 - DC 6 1/4" (302.16')

1- 6 1/4" jars(36.22'), 7- 61/4" DC (208.65')
Mud motor .24* 378 gpm = 91 rpm, + 50 rot table = 141 rpm on bit

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT 8.5 44 8 12 8/24 8.2 2 1.5 tr 9.6 0.5 .4/.6

Smpl E.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PI 10000 80 90 90 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
2% KCL 145 145 12 Chuck Golightly M-I Drilling Fluids

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost
145 255 24 $4,003 6,698

DIRECTK NAL SURVEY$
Mil TVD

5014 5014 3.00 °

53,4 5324 1.00°

PERATI3NS SUNMARY
¡AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1800 12.0 5 Drill4950' to 5084' Time SL mmary
1800 1830 0.5 20 Survey 5014' - 3 deg Activity Daily Cum.
1830 1900 0.5 17 Service rig, Function check annular 1. Mob/DeMob 33
1900 0430 9.5 5 Drill5084' to 5395' 2. Cement 2.5
0430 0500 0.5 20 Survey 5324' - 1 deg 3. Circulate 8
0500 0600 1.0 5 Drilling 5407' 4. Directional Work

5. Drilling 22.5 139.25
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 1.5
11. N.U./ N.D. 10
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 5
13. P.U./L.D. Pige
14. R/U; RID 3

Buck Tongue -0' Castlegate 65' 15. Rig Repair 17.5
Mancos Shale -296' Dakota Silt 3872' 16. Run Casing 2.5
Dakota Sandstone 4062' Morrison (Brushy Basin) 4164' 17. Service Rig 0.5 2
Morrison (Salt Wash) 4534' Moab Tongue 4926' 18. Sidetrack Op.
Entrada 5087' 19. Stuck Pipe

20. Survey 1 6.25
3 - 4748' - 475T, 9'- b 22u, d 25u, after 20u, pale yellowflour & gold cut 21. Trips 16
4 - 4924' to 4941', 17' -b 29 u, d 44 u, a 22 u, paleyellowflor &goldcut 22. Tst. BOPs 5.5
S-508T to 5119'. 32', no gas, pale yellowflour&goldcut 23. UR/HO
BG = 7 - 30 u 24. W.O.W.
CG = 16 - 30 u 25. Wash & Ream 2.5
TG = 0 u 26. Well Control
Max FG = 0 u 27. WOC
3 new shows - No gas readings - oil shows 28. Other 50

Total 24 304.5Total dours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $310,728Daily Daily 760 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $22,968Cum. Cum. 5503 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



MSC Exploration 00NFilEN11AL
no Daily Drillin Report

Block. Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria ûQL Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

Floy Canyon Wildcat- State MSC#2-1 Union #7 32 30 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Oct 9, 2004

MD TVJ Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Compa ty Representative

4,950 4,950 196 $937,000 8,700' Roger Knight

Presênt 9peration Rig Phone: 435-2204999 Toolpusner

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No LC59Sample Date Operator i 10/3/2004 KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date ater Depth ft

Sky U No Pass7 U Yes O No Service 2 11/3/2004 KB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 8.6

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICSREt..ORD

BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

3 7 7/8 Smith ER-7031 MW 4779 16,16,16 3,848' 928' 45 1/2 18/20 45/55 20.4 3 3 1/16

4 7 7/8 Reed HP 51A H38229 16,16,16 4,776' 196' 9 1/2 20/25 45/55 20.6

BitRemarkg: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4 47 240

1 9 x 5.5 2.64 120 378 1320 193 376 207 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 615.57 Description: bit, 1- mud motor (27.59'), 1-IBS (4.93)- 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.82'), 1 IBS (4.20'), 10 - DC 6 1/4" (302.16')

1- 6 1/4" jars(36.22'),7- 61/4" DC (208.65')
Mud motor .24° 378 gpm = 91 rpm, + 50 rot table = 141 rpm on bit

smpi I-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pf! 1600 80 83 8) #1 #2 Desand Cent.
145 145 Chuck Golightly M-I Drilling Fluids

#3 #4 Desilt MudCI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

145 255 $2,040 $11,696

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD ANGLE VS CLOSURE

4830 4830 4.00 *

OPERATIONSSU.1MARY
iAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0800 2.0 5 Drill4754' to 4776'. Lost 400 psi pressure. Time St mmary

0800 0930 1.5 3 Put #1 pump on hole, same pressure loss. Pumped flag, no pressure Activity Daily Cum.

increase. Pumped pill for trip 1. MoblDeMob 33

0930 1400 4.5 21 TOOH Iooking for hole in string, No hole 2. Cement 2.5

1400 1730 3.5 21 Pu bit # 4, new jars,TIH 3. Circulate 2 8

1730 1800 0.5 3 Load hole, circ. Out gas @2912' 4. Directional Work

1800 1830 0.5 21 TIH 5. Drilling 11.5 116.75

1830 1900 0.5 25 Wash & ream 4592' to 4634' 6. Drive Pipe

1900 1930 0.5 21 TlH, Wash & ream 42' to bottom. 7. Fishing

1930 0300 7.5 5 Drill4776' to 4900' 8. OH Logging
0300 0330 0.5 20 Circ and survey4830' - 4 deg 9. Lost Circ.

0330 0400 0.5 17 Service rig, Check pipe rams 10. DrillCmt./LOT 1.5

0400 0600 2.0 5 Drill4900' to 4950' 11. N.U.I N.D. 10
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 5
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. R/U; RID 3

Buck Tongue - 0' Castlegate 65' 15. Rig Repair 17.5

Mancos Shale - 296' Dakota Silt 3872' 16. Run Casing 2.5

Dakota Sandstone 4062' Morrison (Brushy Basin) 4164' 17. Service Rig 0.5 1.5

Morrison (Salt Wash) 4534' Moab Tongue 4926' 18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey 0.5 5.25

No New Show - 21. Trips 9 16

BG = 10 - 31 u 22. Tst. BOPs 5.5

CG = 16 - 23 u 23. UR/HO

TG = 60 u 24. W.O.W.

Max FG = 0 u 25. Wash & Ream 0.5 2.5
26. Well ControlDEC13 2uye 27. WOC
28. Other 50

MVOFnll ci ' MN Total 24 280.5

Total lours 24.0
Rig DONntime Fuel Usage ulk Material on Board Previous Cost $286,294

Daily Daily 672 Gals ement: sx Daily Cost $24,434
Cum. Cum. 4743 Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Explorationn o* Daily Drilling Report
Block. Lease and WellNo. Contract Rig QQj, Qf.g Date on Location Soud Date Recort Date

Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC #2-1 Union #7 31 29 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Oct 8, 2004
Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representative

4,754 4,754 309 $937,000 8,700' Roger Knight
Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50 Sample Date Operator i 10/3/2004 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? O Yes No Service 2 11/3/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth LinerTop MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 8.6

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICS RE(.ORD
BIT BitType and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
3 7 7/8 Smith ER-7031 MW 4779 16,16.16 3,848' 906' 43 1/2 18/20 45/55 20.8

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PL Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 Pump #3

gps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 5.5 2.64 120 378 1280 198 379 209 1/2 62 340
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 615.57 Description: bit, 1- mud motor (27.59'), 1-18S (4.93)- 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.82'), 1 IBS (4.20'), 10 - DC 6 1/4" (302.16')

1- 6 1/4" jars(36.22'), 7- 61/4" DC (208.65')
Mud motor .24* 378 gpm = 91 rpm, + 50 rot table = 141 rpm on bit

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT 8.5 46 7 11 7/14 1.2 2 1.5 tr 9.4 0.4 .2/.3

Smpi I-.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PIT 800 60 88 88 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
% KCL 145 145 Chuck Golightly M-I Drilling Fluids

#3 #4 Desilt Mud Cl Daily Cost Cumulative Cost
145 215 0,9bË 49,6bb

DIRECTK NAL SURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE VS CLOSURE

4507 4507 5.50 °

4660 4650 5.00 *

UPERATidNS SUMMARY
TliAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1100 5.0 5 Drill4445' to 4567' Time St mmary1100 1130 0.5 17 Service rig Activity Daily Cum.
1130 1200 0.5 20 Survey 4507' 5.5 deg 1. Mob/DeMob 331200 0200 14.0 5 Drill4567' to 4720' 2. Cement 2.50200 0230 0.5 20 Survey 4650'- 5 deg 3. Circulate 60230 0600 3.5 5 Drill4720' to 4754' 4. DirectionalWork

5. Drilling 22.5 105.25
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 1.5
11. N.U./ N.D. 10
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 5

Mancos Shale - 0' Dakota '
13. P.U.lL.D.Pipe

Morrison '
14. R/U; R/D 3
15. Rig Repair 17.5

NewShow - 4435' - 4473' (25'); before 30 u, during 75 u, after 28 u 16. Run Casing 2.5
BG = 10 - 30 u 17. Service Rig 0.5 1
CG = 22 - 39 u 18. Sidetrack Op.
TG = 0 u 19. Stuck Pipe
Max FG = 75 u 20. Survey 1 4.75

21. Trips 7
22. Tst. BOPs 5.5
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream 2
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other 50

To 256.5Total dours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $254,299Daily Daily 840 Gals Cement: sx DailyCost $31,995Cum. Cum. 4071 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



M h ol
MSC Exploration 06ÑÊservÎces** Dail Drilling Report

Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria a REg Date on Location Soud Date Recort Date

Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union#7 30 28 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Oct 7, 2004

MR JV_Q Footage AFE No, AFE Amoynt Auth.TD, ComDa « Reoresentative

4,445 4,445 597 $937,000 .8,700' Roger Knight

Present Ooeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Drilling RIq Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: [ ] Yes No LC50Sample Date Operator 1 10/3/2004 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor 11 ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass7 O Yes No Service 2 11/3/2004 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 8.6

BIT, WEIGHŸ, SPEED ANDHfDRAULICSREt.ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

3 77/8 SmithER-7031 MW4779 16,16,16 3,848' 597 21 25/30 35/40 28.4

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

52.25 108 92 102
Pump

Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 | mp #3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 5 5 2.64 120 378 1270 310 379 209 1/2 62 340

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 615.57 Description: bit, 1- mud motor (27.59'), 1-IBS (4.93)- 1- 6 1/4" DC (30 82'), 1 IBS (4.20'), 10 - DC 6 1/4" (302.16')

1- 6 1/4"jars(36.22'), 7- 61/4" DC(208.65')
Mud motor .24* 378 gpm= 91 rpm, + 40 rot table = 131 rpm on bit

Smpi |-.L.

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

li 600 AD 96 86 #1 #2 Desand Cent.
146 145 Chuck Golightly M-I Drilling Fluids

#3 #4 Desilt MudCI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

145 255 $2,866 $ 00

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE CLOSURE

4016 4016 2.00 *

OPERATIONSSUMMARY

i4L Time Boats: SupplyBoat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0800 2.0 25 Wash & ream. 3679 - 3848' Time St mmary

0800 1300 5.0 5 Drill3248' to 3972' Activity Daily Cum.

1300 1330 0.5 15 Rig Repair - Replace 4" union on mud pump 1. MoblDeMob 33

1330 1630 3.0 5 Drill3972' to 4078' 2. Cement 2.5

1630 1700 0.5 20 Survey 4016' - 2 deg 3. Circulate 6

1700 0600 13.0 5 Drill4078' to 4445' 4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 21 82.75
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 1.5
11. N.U./ N.D. 10
12. P.U.lL.D. BHA 5
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U;R/D 3

Mancos Shale - 0' 15. Rig Repair 0.5 17.5
16. Run Casing 2.5
17. Service Rig 0.5

New show - 4064' to 4970'; before 12 u during 159 u, after 21 u 18. Sidetrack Op.

BG = 10 - 30 u 19. Stuck Pipe

CG = 21 - 37 u 20. Survey 0.5 3.75

TG = 1010 u 21. Trips 7

Max FG = 159 u 22. Tst. BOPs 5.5
23. UR/HO

RECEIVED Ts"i"aa..m2 2
26. We11Control

DEC1a 7gg 27. WOC
28. Other 50

Total lours 24.0
Total 24 232.5

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $231,498

Daily Daily 672 Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $22,801
Cum. Cum. 3231 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost $254,299



PPI MSC Explorationne ' Daily Drilling Report
Block. l,ease gnd WallNo. Contract Rio 2.QL R.E§ Date on Location Soud Date Report Date

Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC #2-1 Union #7 29 27 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Oct 6, 2004
MQ TO Footaae AFE No. AFEAmount Auth.TD. Company Representative

3,848 3,848 481 $937,000 8,700' Roger Knight
Present Çperation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

GIH with bit Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 14 Last BOP Test Date RIGELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LCSO Sample Date Operator 1 10/3/2004 KB 15 ft
Seas: Problem7 O Yes Contractor 11 ext BOP Test Date ter Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? O Yes U No Service 2 11/3/2004 KB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 KS5 STC 12 525' 8.6

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED ANDHiDRAULICS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
2 7 7/8 Marquis C683G MB78112 3/8" 525' 3,323' 42 3/5 45 79.1 3 \
3 7 7/8 Smith ER-7031 MW 4779 16,16,16 3,848'

Bit Remarks: Hammer bit good for another well. Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
62.26 110 96 10A

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pump #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 5.5 2.64 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 543.72 Description: bit, 1- mud motor (27.59'), 1-IBS(4.93)- 1- 6 1/4" DC (30.82'), 1 IBS (4.20'), 10 - DC 6 1/4" (302.16')

1- 6 1/4" jars(36.22'),7- 61/4" DC (208.65')
Mud motor .24* stk= rpm, + rot table = rpm on bit

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT 8.6 31

Drilled with air at 2400 cuft/min.& 200 psi

Smpl I-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pil #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEY$
$3,096 SA,836

MD
3522 3522 2.00 °

OPERAT ONS SUL1MARY
i.4E Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1000 4.0 5 Drill336T to 3553' Time St mmary
1000 1030 0.5 20 Survey @3522' 2 deg Activity Daily Cum.
1030 1600 5.5 5 Drill3553 to 3384tr. it water g 3832' 1. Mob/DeMob 33
1600 1700 1.0 3 Clean hole. 2. Cement 2.5
1700 2000 3.0 21 TOOH to lay down hammer 3. Circulate 4.5 62000 2230 2.5 12 Pick up motor and IBS. Function blind rams 4. Directional Work
2230 0000 1.5 21 TlH 5. Drilling 9.5 61.75
0000 0300 3.0 3 Mix mud, build volume. Vis 31, fillpipe 6. Drive Pipe
0300 0430 1.5 21 TIH to 2301'. 7. Fishing
0430 0500 0.5 3 Fill pipe, break circulation, mix mud 8. OH Logging
0500 0600 1.0 21 TIH 9. Lost Circ.

10. DrillCmt./LOT 1.5
11. N.U./N.D. 10
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 2.5 5

Rained in aftemoon. No big problems 13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. RIU; RID 3

Mancos Shale - O' 15. Rig Repair 17
16. Run Casing 2.5
17. Service Rig 0.5

No new shows 18. Sidetrack Op.
BG = 12 - 93 u 19. Stuck Pipe
CG = 12-120 u 20. Survey 0.5 3.25
TG = 305 21. Trips 7 7
Max FG = 0 u 22. Tst. BOPs 5.5

23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other 50

Total 24 208.5Total tours 24.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $205,728Daily Daily 795 Gals Cement: sx DailyCost $25,770Cum. Cum. 2559 Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



MSC Exploration
servi"ce,

' Daily Drilling Report
Block.Lease andWellNo. Contract Ria QQL _Dig Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union#7 28 26 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Oct 5, 2004

Mg TV) Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth.TD. Company Representative

3,367 3,367 1,820 $937,000 8,700' Roger Knight

Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Dillling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No LC50Sample Dpte Operator 10/3/2004 KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? U Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date ater Depth ft

Sky: O No Pass7 O Yes O No Service 11/5Ñ004 KB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 525' 8.6

BIT,WEIGHT, SPEED ANDHIDRAULICSREt,ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth | Bearing Gage

2 7 7/8 Marquis C683G MB78112 3/8" S25' 2,842' 32 3/4 3/5 40 86.8

SitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

62.26 110 95 104

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 5.5 2.64 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: 643.72 Description: Air hammer bit(4.66') - bit sub (3.21'), 12- 6 1/4" DC (362.19'), jars (36.22'), 6 - DC 6 1/4" (179.46')

MUDDATA
WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm PflMf

PIT
Drillingwith air at 2400 cuft/min.&200 psi

Smpi ËL.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pli #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt MudCI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

$760 $1, [40

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS CLOSURE

3.75 *

3011 3011 3.26°

OPERATIONS SU.1MARY
AL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 1130 5.5 5 Drill 154T to 2069' Time St mmary

1130 1200 0.5 20 Survey @2019' - 3.75 deg Activity Daily Cum.

1200 1230 0.5 17 Semice Rig 1. Mob/DeMob 33

1230 1800 5.5 5 Drill2069' to 2564' 2. Cement 2.5

1800 1845 0.8 20 Survey g 2514' - 3.75 deg 3. Circulate 1.5

1845 0130 6.8 5 Drill2564' to 3061' 4. Directional Work

0130 0200 0.5 20 Survey g 3011' - 3.25 deg 5. Drilling 21.75 52.25

0200 0600 4.0 5 Drill3061' to 3367' 6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT 1.5
11. N.U./ N.D. 10
12. P.U.lL.D. BHA 2.5
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 3

Mancos Shale -0'
15. Rig Repair 17

16. Run Casing 2.5
17. Service Rig 0.5 0.5

No new shows 18. Sidetrack Op.

BG = 12 - 93 u 19. Stuck Pipe

CG = 26 - 364 u 20. Survey 1.75 2.75

TG = nla 21. Trips

Max FG = 0 u 22. Tst. BOPs 5.5
23. UR/HO

2' flare lasting 15 sec after survey @259 24. W.O.W.

6' flare lasting 60 sec after survey g 3011' 25. Wash & Ream
26. Well ControlDEC13 2ug4 27.woe
28. Other 50

DV F TTai
¯24 ¯

184 5

Total dours 24.0 04|!

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious Cost $178,387

Daily Daily 1050 Gals Cement: sx ally Cost $27,341

Cum. Cum. 1764 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
"c

' Daily Drilling Report
Bigêk, Lease and Well No, Contract Rig QQL _DFS pate on Ççcatlon Spud Qate Repert Date

Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC #2-1 Union #7 27 25 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Oct 4, 2004
TV_D Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representative

1,547 1,547 1,037 $937,000 8,700' Roger Knight
Present ODeration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Drilling Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 15 Last BOP Test Date RIGELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes No LCSO Sample Date Operator 1 10/3/2004 RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: No Pass? O Yes No Senrice 3 RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 KSS STC 12 525' 8.6

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HiDRAULICS RELORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
2 7 7/8 Marquis C683G MB78112 3/8" 525' 1,022' 12 3/5 45 85.2

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Tor ue

Pump Slow Pump PressuresNo. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 1Pump #3
gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 5.5 2.64 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

eHnAgth:
543.72 Description: Air hammer bit(4.66') - bit sub (3.21'), 12- 6 1/4" DC (362.19'), jars (36.22'), 6 - DC 6 1/4" (179.46')

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL% SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT

Drilling with air at 2400 cuft/min.& 230 psi

Smpi |-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pfl #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE VS CLOSURE

2.00 °

1417 1497 3.75°

)PERATI3NS SUA MARY
Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0900 3.0 11 Nippling up blooie line for air drilling. Installed wear bushing Time St mmary
0900 1200 3.0 14 Rig up air lines Activity Daily Cum.
1200 1430 2.5 12 PU BHA. Installed rotating head. 1. Mob/DeMob 331430 1530 1.0 3 Unload hole with air 2. Cement 2.51530 1700 1.5 10 Tagged cement g 445'. Drilled plug & cement 445' to 525' 3. Circulate 1 1.5
1700 2330 6.5 5 Drill from 525' to 1057', Survey @506' - 2 deg 4. Directional Work
2330 0000 0.5 20 Survey g 1007' - 2 deg 5. Drilling 12 30.50000 0530 5.5 5 Drill from 1057' to 1547' 6. Drive Pipe
0530 0600 0.5 20 Survey g 144T - 3.75 deg 7. Fishing

8. OHLogging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt.lLOT 1.5 1.5
11. N.U./N.D. 3 10
12. P.U./L.D. BHA 2.5 2.5
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D 3 3

Mancos Shale - 0' 15. RigRepair 17
16. Run Casing 2.5
17. Service Rig

No new shows 18. Sidetrack Op.
BG = 2 - 72 u 19. Stuck Pipe
CG = 0 u 20. Survey 1 1
TG = n/a 21. Trips
Max FG = 126 u 22. Tst. BOPs 5.5

23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other SO

Total 24 160.5Total iours 24.0
Rig Do vntime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board revious Cost $126,375Daily Daily 714 Gals Cement: sx allyCost $52,012Cum. Cum. 714 Gals Barite: sx um. Cost



MSC Exploration
v s Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease andWellNo. Contract Ria QQL QFFE Date on Location Soud Date Report Date

Floy Canyon Wildcat•State MSC#2-1 Union#7 26 24 9/7/04 Sep 9, 2004 Oct 3, 2004

MD TV_D Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Companv Representative

510 510 $937,000 8,700' Roger Knight

Present Queration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 oolDusher

RUBlooleline to pit. Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 12 Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No LC50 Sample Date Operator 1 10/3/04 KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? Ü Yes Contractor 11 Next BOP Test Date ater Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass7 U Yes O No Service 11/3/04 KB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 510' 8.6

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED ANDH IDRAULICSREt ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pump #3
qs DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 5 5 2.64 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

LHe
gth: Description:

M

Smpi I-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PI #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

I
DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS

MD TVD ANGLE Direction Coordinates VS DL CLOSURE

OPERAT ONS SUMMARY
ME Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 2100 15.0 1 Finish rigging up Union #7. Time St mmary

2100 2300 2.0 11 NU BOPs' & rotating head on casinghead. Activity Daily Cum.

2300 0000 1.0 11 PU kelly 1. Mob/DeMob 15 33

0000 0530 5.5 22 Pressure test kelly and BOP's. Rams to 3000 psi for 10 mins. Annular 2. Cement 2.5

to 1500 psi for 10 mins. Choke and killlines, upper kelly, safety vahres 3. Circulate 0.5

choke manifold to 3000 psi for 10 mins. Alltested to 250 psi low for 4. Directional Work

5 mins. 5. Drilling 18.5

0530 0600 0.5 28 Test casing to 1500 psi for 30 mins. OK. 6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. LostCirc.
10. Drill Cmt./LOT
11. N.U./ N.D. 3 7
12. P.U.lL.D. BHA
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D
15. Rig Repair 17
16. Run Casing 2.5
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs 5.5 5.5
23. UR/HO

HP SVED 24.W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream

28. Other 0.5 50

Total lours 24.o
UW.OF0 6µ¶ R.µ Total 24 136.5

Rig Do wntime Fuel Usage . Bulk Material on Board revious Cost $120,705
Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx allyCost $5,670
Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx um. Cost



PPI MSC Explorationu o* Daily Drilling Report
Block. Legse and WellNo. ÇontrgotRig & QË Date on Location Soud Date Report Date

Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC #2-1 Union #7 25 23 9/7/04 Sep 9, 2004 Oct 2, 2004
TV_D Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative

510 510 $937,000 8,700' Roger Knight
Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

Prep to move remainder of loads to location Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50 Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass7 U Yes U No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth LinerTop MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7
Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 510' 8.6

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICS RELORD
BIT BitType and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROl Wt Torque
18.6

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM

gps
1 9 x 5.5 2.64 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

L gth: Description:

Smpi Ë.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PI #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt MudCl DailyCost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE VS CLOSURE

1PERATIONS SUIVMARY
TIME Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1600 10.0 28 RePairingwashed out road and location. Time SL mmary

Activity Daily Cum.
1. Mob/DeMob 18
2. Cement 2.5
3. Circulate 0.5
4. DirectionalWork
5. Drilling 18.5
6. DrivePipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. LostCirc.
10. DrillCmt.lLOT
11. N.U./ N.D. 4
12. P.U./L.D. BHA
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D
15. Rig Repair 17
16. Run Casing 2.5
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. WellControl
27. WOC
28. Other 10 49.5

Total 10 112.5Total iours 10.0
Rig DONntime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board revious Cost $118,635Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx ailyCost $2,070Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx um. Cost



MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block,Lease andWellNo, Contract Ria g Date on Location Saud Date Report Date

FloyCanyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union#7 24 22 9/7/04 Sep 9, 2004 Oct 1, 2004

MQ Ty.D Footaae AFENe AFEAmount Auth. TO. Compa ty Representative
$937,000 8,700' Roger Knight

Present Queration Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 ToolDusher

Repairing road Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: |__|Yes O No LC50 Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 O Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass7 O Yes _ÍNo Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W i 20'

Surface 8 5/8" 24 KSS STC 12 510' 8.6

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED AND H IDRAULICSRECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hra PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

18.5

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 Pump #3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 5.5 2.64 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: Description:

Smpi E.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours MudEngineer Mud Company

II #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Deslit Mud Cl Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

l
DIRECTIONAL SU IVEYS

MD TVD ANGLE Direction Coordinates VS DL CLOSURE

OPERAT ONS SUE1MARY

.AL Time Boats: SupplyBoat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0600 SD for rain and flash flooding. Time St mmary
Activity Daily Cum.

Should move remainder of loads from 35-1 today. 1. Mob/DeMob 18
2. Cement 2.5
3. Circulate 0.5
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 18.5
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.UJ N.D. 4
12. P.U.lL.D. BHA
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. R/U; RID
15. Rig Repair 17
16. Run Casing 2.5
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO

RECOVED 2245 W
eam

26. Well Control

DEC13 2004 27.woe
28. Other 39.5

Total dours
DI"OFOIL,CAD&MMNb

votal 102.5

Rig DONntime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious Cost $116,565

Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx ailyCost $2,070
Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx um. Cost



PPI MSC Explorationne f.,.<..ßailyDrilling Report
Block. Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria Q_Q.L QËg Date on Location Soud Date Repert Datp

Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union#7 23 21 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Sep 30, 2004
MD TV_D Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representêtive

$937,000 8,700' Roger Knight
Present Operptien Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

SD for flash flooding and rain Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes No LC50Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: No Pass7 O Yes No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Uner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 510' 8.6

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICS RELORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

It Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt RO1 Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps 1/4
1 9 x 5.5 2.64 1/2
2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

BHA
Length: Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT

Smpl F.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pli #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE VS CLOSURE

JPERATI3NS SUA MARY
[AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 1400 8.0 1 SD Mobilization due to flash flooding on access road. One crew on Time St mmary

location rigging up. SD for high water. Activity Daily Cum.
1. Mob/DeMob 8 18
2. Cement 2.5
3. Circulate 0.5
4. Directional Work

Plan to resume Mobilization tomorrow. 5. Drilling 18.5
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt ILOT
11. N.U./ N.D. 4
12. P.U./L.D. BHA
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D
15. Rig Repair 17
16. Run Casing 2.5
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other 39.5

Total 8 102.5Total dours 8.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage BulkMaterial on Board Previous Cost $114,495Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $2,070Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



MPPI MSC Exploration
e ou Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease and Well No. Contract Ria 09.6 Of.$. Date on Location Soud Date Report pate
FloyCanyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union#7 22 20 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Sep 29, 2004

MR TV__Q Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth TO Compa w Representative

510 510 $937,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander

Present Operation Rig Phone: 435-220-0999 Toolousher

SD Mobilization due to flash flooding Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: L.]Yes U No LCSO Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: O No Pass? O Yes O No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth LinerTop MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'

Surface 8 5/8" 24 KSS STC 12 510' 8.6

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED ANDHfDRAULICSREt ORD

BIT BitType and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarky: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

NO. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2

ggs DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 5,5 2.64 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

LHe
gth: Description:

ÑUDDATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT

Smpi |-.L

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

if #1 #2 Desand Cent

#3 #4 Desilt Mud Cl Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD ANGLE CLOSURE

OPERAT ONS SUilMARY
EAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 1800 12.0 Howecroft Trucking mobilizing rig to location Time St mmary
Activity Daily Cum.

1. Mob/DeMob 10
2. Cement 2.5
3. Circulate 0.5
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 18.5
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. Drill Cmt./LOT
11. N.U./ N.D. 4
12, P.U.lL.D. BHA
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D
15. Rig Repair 17

16. Run Casing 2.5
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.

RECEIV !) 25.Wash&Ream
26. Well Control

llFC 1 g 27. woo
28. Other 39.5

Total 94.5

Total iours 12.0 6/D
Rig DONntime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $112,425

Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx DailyCost $2,070
Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



Debra Olson

From: Williams, Galan [gwilliams@PPITech.net]
Sent: Tuesday, October 19, 2004 9:06 AM
To: 'Debra Olson'
Subject: RE: Daily Drilling Cost 2-1

Didn't have any...........

-----Original Message-----
From: Debra Olson [mailto:dkorel@sbcglobal.net]
Sent: Tuesday, October 19, 2004 9:30 AM
To: Galan Williams
Cc: Lynn Faust
Subject: Daily Drilling Cost 2-1

Good Morning Again!
I'm also missing Daily Drilling Cost Reports on the 2-1 for 9/20, 9/21,
9/22, 9/23, 9/24, 9/25, 9/26, 9/27, and 9/28.
Can you please send them to me?
Thank you,
Debbie

Outgoing mail is certified Virus Free.
Checked by AVG anti-virus system (http://www.grisoft.com).
Version: 6.0.778 / Virus Database: 525 - Release Date: 10/15/2004

Incoming mail is certified Virus Free.
Checked by AVG anti-virus system (http://www.grisoft.com).
Version: 6.0.778 / Virus Database: 525 - Release Date: 10/15/2004



2 * *

MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease and WellNo, Contract RIa R.OL RES. Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

FloyCanyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union #7 12 10 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Sep 19, 2004

MQ R Footaqe AFE No. AFSAmognt Auth. TD. Compa ly Representative

510 510 $937,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander

Present Ooeration Rig Phone: 435-2204999 Toolpusher

MobilizingUnionRig #7 Rig Fax: 435-220-0999 Conrad Tenney

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: 12 ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes U No LC50Sample Date Operator 1 RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? U Yes Contractor 11 ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes O No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W i 20'

Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 510' 8.6

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED AND HIDRAULIch Recomb
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

ßitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

18.5

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 5.5 2.64 1/2

2 9 x 6 3.15 3/4

LHe
gth: Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLOS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT

Smpl I-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PD #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt MudCI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONALŠURVEYS
MD

CLOSURE

OPERAT ONS SUi1MARY
Tli (E Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0900 3.0 28 Waiting on trucks Time St mmary

0900 1900 10.0 1 Moving rig, Five trucks moving equipment Activity Daily Cum.

1. MoblDeMob 10 10

Finish moving equipment today 2. Cement 2.5

Rigging up tomorrow 3. Circulate 0.5

4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 18.5

6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U.! N.D. 4
12. P.U./L.D. BHA
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D
15. RigRepair 17
16. Run Casing 2.5

17, Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.

RR;HVED 25.Wash&Ream
26. Well Control

Totai 13 94.5

Total dours 13.0 Ut V.U
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $107,846

Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $4,579

Cum. Cum. Gafs Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Explorations** Daily Drilling Report
Block. Lease and WellNo. Contrpçt Riq Q_QL U Qateon Lgçgtion Soud Date Report Date

Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC #2-1 Union #7 11 9 9/7/04 Sep 9, 2004 Sep 18, 2004m Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representative
510 510 $937,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander

Present Operption Rig Phone: Toolousher
WO Union Rig #7 Rig Fax: Todd Beeman

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: Yes O No LCSO Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date Water Depth 11
Sky: No Pass7 O Yes No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 510' 8.6

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H/DRAULICSREC ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump PressuresNo. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pump #2 Pum #3
gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2
2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

eHnAgth:
Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT

smpi I-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud CompanyPii #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt MudCt Daily Cost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE VS CLOSURE

( PERATK NS SUMdARY
¡AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0900 3.0 28 WO Cameron Wellhead & welder Time St mmary0900 1300 4.0 11 Install 8-5/8" SO x 11", 3M casinghead. Test to 700 psi. OK. Install Activity Daily Cum.

cover over hole. SD untill Union Rig #7 moves on location. 1. Mob/DeMob
2. Cement 2.5
3. Circulate 0.5
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 18.5
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OHLogging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt.lLOT
11. N.U./ N.D. 4 4
12. P.U./L.D. BHA
13. P.U./LD. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D
15. RigRepair 17
16. Run Casing 2.5
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash &Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other 3 36.5

Total 7 81.5Total lours 7.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulk Material on Board Previous Cost $97,312Daily Daily Gals ement: sx Daily Cost $10,534Cum. Cum. Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration t
'

- ne Daily Drilling Report
Block. Lease and Well No. Contract Rig 9,9L DES Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

FloyCanyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union#7 10 8 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Sep 17, 2004

ylD TV) Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. T(L Compa ly Representative
$937,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander

Present Ooeration Rig Phone: Toolousher
Rig Fax: Todd Beeman

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No LC50Sample Date Operator KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date ater Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass? Yes O No Service KB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth LinerTop MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 510' 8.6

BIÝ,WEIGHT, SPÊED AND HiDRAuLIC$ REt,ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Rit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 Pumpi

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

BHA
Length: Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT

Smpi F.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

#1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
TVD ANGLE

OPERATIONS SUMMARY
ijlE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0600 RD Beeman Rathole. Instaff ceffar ring around well. Time St mmary
Activity Daily Cum.

1, Mob/DeMob
2. Cement 2.5

3. Circulate 0.5
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 18.5

6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Loqqing
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U,/ N.D.
12. P.U.lL.D. BHA
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. RIU; R/D
15. Rig Repair 17
16. Run Casing 2.5
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.

RECHVED 25.Wash&Ream

Total 66.5

Total iours V.Û
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious Cost $87,363

Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx allyCost $9,949

Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx um. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
ne * Daily Drilling Report

Block, L,9ase and Well No. Contract Rig _DQL QEg Dpte on Location Soud Date Report ppte
Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC #2-1 Union #7 9 7 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Sep 16, 2004

TV__D Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative
510 510 $937,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander

Present Qperation Rig Phone: Toolousher
Prep to set cellar ring Rig Fax: Todd Beeman

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIGELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes No LC50 Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date Water Depth 11

Sky: No Pass? O Yes U No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 K55 STC 12 510' 8.6

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HiDRAULICS REt ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

BitRemprks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
18.5

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pump #3

gps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2
2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

LHe
gth: Description:

M

Smpi E.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pll #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
TVD CLOSURE

IPERATIONS SUL MARY
TIDIE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0800 2.0 28 Wo rig crews Time SL mmary
0800 1400 6.0 28 Drill & set RH & MH. Prep to set cellar today. Activity Daily Cum.

1. MoblDeMob
2. Cement 2.5
3. Circulate 0.5
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 18.5
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D.BHA
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D
15. RigRepair 17
16. Run Casing 2.5
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
d. survey

21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other 8 25.5

¯iosi" ¯¯¯š¯

66.5
Total dours 8.0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulk Material on Board revious Cost $86,263
Daily Daily Gals ement: sx ailyCost $1,100Cum. Cum. Gals arite: sx um, Cost



2 f t

N MSC Exploration
no o*

gg Daily Drilling Report
Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria D.Eg Dete on Leçëtion Soud Date Renoit Date

FloyCanyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union #7 8 6 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Sep 15, 2004

MR R Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth.TD. Company Representative

510 510 $937,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander

Present Operptien Rig Phone: Toolpusher

Waitingin cement Rig Fax: Todd Beeman

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: aat BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: U Yes O No LC50Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass7 U Yes U No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'

Surface 8 5/8" 24 KS5 STC 12 510' 8.6

BIT, WEIGHÝ,SPEED ANDHIDRAULICSRËLORD

BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROl Wt Torque

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed Pu

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

L gth: Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm PflMf

PIT

Smpi I-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pil #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Dally Cost Cumulative Cost

DIREÒTIONAL SURVEYS
VS

OPERATIONSSUE1MARY
E Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0800 2.0 28 WO rig crews Time St mmary

0800 1030 2.5 16 Run 8 5/8" casing to 510'. 12 jts, K55, STC, 24#lft. Float collar at 472' Activity Daily Cum.

1030 1100 0.5 3 RU &Circulate. Fill casing with mud 1. Mob/DeMob

1100 1330 2.5 2 Cement with 300 sx Ready Mix. 2 bbls into displacement, cement to surface 2. Cement 2.5 2.5

Bump plugat 450 psi. Set well. 3. Circulate 0.5 0.5

SDFN &WOC 4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 18.5

6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D
15. Rig Repair 17
16. Run Casing 2.5 2.5
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.

DECEIVE¡> 25.Wash&Ream
26. Well Control

._ 11FP1 g gg 27. woo
28. Other 2 17.5

Total 7.5 58.5

Total -lours 7.5
Ol"OFDAL, GAh 4 gggig

Rig Donntime Fuet Usage Bulk Materfalon Board P evious Cost $49,938

Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $36,325

Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Explorationn ' Daily Drilling Report
Block. Lease pnd Well No. Contract Riq QQL Q.Eg Date enLocatlon Saud Date Report Date

Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union #7 7 5 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Sep 14, 2004
MD g Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representative
510 510 140 $937,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander

Present Operation Rig Phone: oolpusher
Prep to run 8-5/8" Surface Casing Rig Fax: Todd Beeman

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.; Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50 Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? O Yes O No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20°

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICS RELORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
1 12 Air Hammer Bit 20' 510' 18 1/2 27.6

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
18.6

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pump #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2
2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

BHA
Length: Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT

Smpl I-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pli #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt MudCI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE VS

PERATIONSSUNMARY
ME Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0800 2.0 28 WO crews Time St mmary
0800 1600 8.0 5 Air drill to 510'. Activity Daily Cum.

Plan to run 8-5/8" surface casing on 9/14 am. Plan to cement at 1300 hrs 1. Mob/DeMob
2. Cement

DONR called, Fri, Sat, Sun, Mon unable to leave message 3. Circulate
State office called Mon. left message. 4. Directional Work

5. Drilling 8 18.5
Galan Williams notified Bart Kettle with DONR of casing cementing job. 6. Drive Pipe

7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt.lLOT
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA
13. P.U./LD. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D
15. Rig Repair 17
16. Run Casing
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other 2 15.5

Total 10 51Total dours 10.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $48,058Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $1,880Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



MSC Exploration
ne*| Daily Ðrilling Report

Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract Ria 99]. RER Dçte on Locptien Soud Date Report Date

Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union #7 6 4 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Sep 13, 2004

TV_Q Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Compe iy Representative

370 370 $937,000 8,700' Carl Hufstander

Present Operation Rig Phone: Toolousher

Prep todrillahead Rig Fax: Todd Beeman

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No LC50Sample Date Operator KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date ater Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass7 U Yes|LJNo Service KB-CHF ft

CASINGRECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED ANDHIDRAULICSREGORD

BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

1 12 Alr Hammer Bit 20' 350' 10 1/2 33.3

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt RO1 Wt Torque

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No, Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 Jumg#3
gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 14 x 5,5 4.37 3/4

BHA
Length: Description:

MUDDATA
WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm PflMf

PIT

Smpi P.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pl I #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud Cl DailyCost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE VS

OPERAT ONS SUL4MARY
iAL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0600 SD for Sunday. Prep to drill ahead Monday moming. Time St mmary
Activity Daily Cum.

1. MoblDeMob
2. Cement
3. Circulate
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 10.5

6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U.lL.D. BHA
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. RIU; RID
15. Rig Repair 17

16. Run Casing
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe

20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.

DECEIVEU DecinÎro
27. WOC

DECI a ÿÿ 28. Other 13.5
Total 41

Total Bours
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board s Cost $48.058

Daily Dally Gals Cement: sx DailyCost

Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
1 of" Daily Drilling Report

Blqck, Lease and Well No. Contract Riq _DQL M Date on Leçatien Soud Date Reoort Date
Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union#7 5 3 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Sep 12, 2004

MD TVQ Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representative
370 370 155 $937,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander

Present Opêration Rig Phone: oolousher
Shyut Down for Sunday Rig Fax: Todd Beeman

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50 Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date Water Depth 11
Sky: U No Pass7 Yes No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth LinerTop MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7
Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HfDRAULICS RECORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
1 12 Air Hammer Bit 20' 350' 10 1/2 33.3

BitRemarkg: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque
6.6

PumP Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2
2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

L gth: Description:

Smpi P.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PI f #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE VS CLOSURE

JPERATIONS SUN MARY
DIE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0800 2.0 28 WO crews Time St mmary
0800 1500 7.0 15 Repairing rig Activity Daily Cum.
1500 1900 4.0 5 Drilling to 370' 1. Mob/DeMob

2. Cement
3. Circulate
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling 4 10.5

Sunday down 6. Drive Pipe
Shut down until Monday 7. Fishing
Cement planned for Tuesday @0900. DONR willbe notified 8. OH Logging

9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA
13. P.U./L.D. Pige
14. RIU; R/D
15. Rig Repair 7 17
16. Run Casing
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other 2 13.5

Total 13 41Total lours 13.0
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $47,380Daily Daily Gals Cement sx Daily Cost $678Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration bL
ne aily Drilling Report

Block.Lease andWellNo. Contract Ria 9.06 DEâ Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

FloyCanyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union#7 4 2 9/7/2004 Sep 9, 2004 Sep 11, 2004

Mg B Footage AFRNo. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative

215 215 37 $937,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander

Present Operation Rig Phone: Toolousher

Rig Repair to AirHammer & Pump Rig Fax: Todd Beeman

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes L_j No LC50Sample Date Operator KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date ater Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes O No Service KB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'

BIT,WEIGHT,SPEED ANDHIDRAULICSREt,0RD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

1 12 Air Hammer Bit 20' 195' 6 1/2 30.0

Bit Remgrks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROl Wt Torque

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pumpg Pump #3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

LHe
gth: Description:

MUDDATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OlL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT

Smpi F.L.

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pfl #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Deslit Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE VS

OPERATONS SU.tMARY
:AL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0800 2.0 28 WO crews to arrive Time St mmary

Beeman stuck and broke down @215'. Worked free, could not drill Activity Daily Cum.

ahead 1. Mob/DeMob

0800 1800 10.0 15 WO parts for rig and injeetion pump 2. Cement
Repaired rig. Est. ready to drill9/11 3. Circulate

1800 hrs. Contacted Rod, toolpusherfor Beeman 4. Directional Work

Still making repairs through9/11/04 5. Drilling 6.5
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U.I N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; RID
15. Rig Repair 10 10
16. Run Casing
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs

RECEIVEU
fiv°.
25. Wash & Ream

AFC1 3 2004 26. WellControl
27. WOC
28. Other 2 11.5

0 ÚFÙ\L, GAS&MINlg Total 12 28

Total dours 12.0

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board revious Cost $45,740

Daily Daily Gals Cement; sx allyCost $1,640
Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



MSC Explorationne * Daily Drilling Report
Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract Rig _DQL QFFE Date on Location Soud Date ReDOrt Date

Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC #2-1 Union#7 3 1 9/7/04 Sep 9, 2004 Sep 10, 2004
MD g Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representative
178 178 $937,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander

Prepent Çperption Rig Phone: Tegipyyher
Rig Fax: Todd Beeman

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes [_ No LC50Sample Daty Operator RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: No Pass? O Yes No Service RKB-CHF it

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor 12-3/4" 24 LP W 1 20'

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H <bRAULICSRE( ORD
BIT BitType and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage
1 12 AirHammer Bit

Bit Remarky: Cum. ROT.Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
NO. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2
2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

BHA
Length: Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT

smpl F.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours MudEngineer Mud Company

PIT #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud Cl Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE VS

OPERAT ONS SUE1MARY
iÆ Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0730 1.5 28 Bob Beeman Drillingsetting conductor and surface Time SL mmary0730 1400 6.5 5 Spudded well @0730 drilling 12" hole. Drilling@ 178' @ 1400 hrs. Activity Daily Cum.

SDFN 1. Mob/DeMob
2. Cement
3. Circulate

Did not retum to 2-1 g Beeman's quittingtime. In Moab, for wellsign 4. Directional Work
Bart Kettle, DONR,called wanted cementingtime for surface casing 5. Drilling 6.5 6.5
Attempts to communicate withBeeman have continued to fail (2 days) 6. Drive Pipe
Advised Bart Kettle, that Carl would ca11DONR thisAM for est. time 7. Fishing

8. OH Logging .
9. Lost Circ.
†0. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D.BHA
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. RIU; R/D
15. Rig Repair
16. Run Casing
17. Service Rip
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pige'
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other 1.5 9.5

Total 8 16Total iours 8.0
Rig Do.vntime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $18,009Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx DailyCost $27,731Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



MPPI MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract Rio 0..96 Of. Date on Location SDud Date Recort Date

FloyCanyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union#7 2 9/7/04 Sep 9, 2004

MD JV_D Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Compa ty Representative

20 20 20 $937,0DO 8,700' Carl Hulslander

Present Qperatlon Rig Phone: ToolDUSher

SDFN Rig Fax: Todd Beeman

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No LC50Sample Date Operator KB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date ater Depth 11

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes O No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor 12-1/4" LP W 1 20'

BIT, WEfGHT, SPEED ANDH/DRAULICSRE( ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

1 14-3/4" Air Hammer bit 20' 2 10.0

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pump #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

LHe
gth: Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm PflMf

PIT

Smpi Ë.L.

Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

#1 #2 Desand Cent

#3 #4 Desl1t Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
ANGLE

OPERAT ONS SUtiMARY
iAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 1400 8.0 28 MIRU Bob Beeman Drilling Time St mmary

Set 12-3/4" Conductor @20'. SDFN Activity Daily Cum.

1. Mob/DeMob
2. Cement
3. Circulate
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. Drill Cmt./LOT
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U.lL.D. BHA
13. P.U.IL.D. Pipe
14. RIU; R/D
15. Rig Repair
16. Run Casing
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream

RECEIVED 26.WellControl
27. WOC

Total dours 8.0
RIq Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board n p gi (pvious Cost $18,009

Daily Daily Gals Cement: kx udily Cost

Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Block, Lease and Well No. Contract Riq QËâ Date on Location Soud Date Report Date
Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC #2-1 Union #7 1 9/7/04 Sep 8, 2004

MD TV_D Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representative
$937,000 8,700' Cad Hulslander

Present Operation Rig Phone: Toolousher
MIRU Beeman Rathole rig Rig Fax: Todd Beeman

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50Sample Date Operator KB 15 it
Seas: Problem7 U Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date ater Depth 11
Sky: O No Pass? O Yes No Service KB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H/DRAULICSREf..ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarkg: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump PressuresNo. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2
gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2
2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

BHA
Length: Description:

Smpi |-.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours MudEngineer Mud Com any

PII #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE

OPERAT ONS SUllMARY
¡AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0600 Finish working county road. Set anchors for rig. MIRU Bob Beeman Time SL mmary

Rathole. Activity Daily Cum.
1. Mob/DeMob
2. Cement
3. Circulate
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OHLogging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U./N.D.
12. P.U.iL.D. BHA
13. P.U./L.D.Pige
14. R/U; R/D
15. Rip Repair
16. Run Casing
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other

TotalTotal lours
Rig DONntime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $3,500Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $14,509Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration bIÑ¡nc
4 & , Daily Drillingkeport

Block.Lease and WellNo. CorttractRia 9.Q.L Œg Date on Location Soud Date RODOrt Date

FloyCanyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union #7 Sep 7, 2004

MD M Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth.TD. Company Representative

$937,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander

Present ODeration Rig Phone: Toolpusher

Working on County Road Rig Fax:

Current Weather DONR VIsit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: |__|Yes O No LC50Sample Date Operator KB 15 11

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date ater Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass7 O Yes U No Service KB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth LinerTop MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff7

Conductor

BIT, WEIGHT,SPEED AND H /DRAULICS REf ORD

BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Foota e Hrs WOB Rpm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No, Stroke X LIner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pump #3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3,15 1/2

2 14 x S.5 4,37 3/4

L gth: Description:

MUDDATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT

Smpi I--L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

Pfi #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE VS

OPERAT ONS SUMMARY
UIL Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0600 Working on county road and hauling rock. Time St mmary
Activity Daily Cum.

1. Mob/DeMob
2. Cement
3. Circulate
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OHLogging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U.! N.D.
12. P.U.lL.D. BHA
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. RIU; RID
15. Rig Repair
16. Run Casing
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO

RECEIVED 24.W.O.W.
25. Wash &Ream
26. WellControlDEC13 2004 27,WOC
28. Other

Total iours

Total

Rig Do.vntime Fuel Usage ulk Material on Board Previous Cost $3,500

Daily Daily Gals ement: sx Daily Cost
Cum. Cum. Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration'
Daily Drilling Report

Block. Lease and Well Ng. Contract Riq Q.QL _QER Date on Location Soud Date Report Date
Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC #2-1 Union #7 Sep 6, 2004

MD Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Representative
$937,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander

Present Çperation Rig Phone: Toolousher
Working on County Road Rig Fax:

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: O No Pass? O Yes O No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor

BIT, WEIGHT,SPEED AND H IDRAULICS RET ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remprks Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROl Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump PressuresNo. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3
gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2
2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

L gth: Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT

Smpi KL.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PIT #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONALSURVEYS
TVD

PE RATIONS SUM AIARY
TI,AE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0600 MI Poorboy Mining & Construction. Working on county road and hauling Time St mmary

rock. Activity Daily Cum.
1. Mob/DeMob
2. Cement
3. Circulate
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling
6. DrivePipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U./N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D
15. Rig Repair
16. Run Casing
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other

ToûTotal iours
Rig Do,vntime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous Cost $3,500Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily CostCum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum, Cost



"$°"Qx Da
IS r nort

Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract RIa 2QL RES Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date

FloyCanyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union#7 Sep 3, 2004

M Jyg Footaae AFSNo. AFF Amount Auth. TP. Company Representative
$937,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander

Present ODeration Rig Phone: Toolousher
Working on County Road Rig Fax:

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date R1G ELEVATIONS

Wind: U vos ü No LOSO Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 Ü Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass7 O Yes U No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff9

Conductor

Bil, WË\GHT,SPEËD ANDHIDRAULlü8 RË(ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number .Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

PumP
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Uner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

qps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

LHe
gth: Description:

Smpi I-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

#1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI DailyCost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONALSURVEYS
MD ANGLE VS

OPERATONS SUMMARY
ThÆ Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0600 Watering, gradingand preparing county for rock. Enlarge reserve pit. Time St mmary
Activity Daily Cum.

1. Mob/DeMob
2. Cement
3. Circulate
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OHLogging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT

11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D
15. Rig Repair
16. Run Casing
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO

RECEIVED 24.W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well ControlDECf aam 27.woe
28. Other

Total iours , 00 (A i (y
Rig DcNntime Fuel Usage ulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $3,500

Daily Daily Gals ement: sx Daily Cost
Cum. Cum. Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Explorationn o* Daily Drilling Report
Block. Lease and WellNo, Contrpet Riq Q.QI, & Date on Location Soud Date Report Date

Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union #7 Sep 2, 2004
MD TV__D Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Comoany Representative

$937,000 8,700' Cad Hulslander
Prêqênt Operation Rig Phone: Toolousher

Waiting on Rock for County Road Rig Fax: David Wilcox

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes LJ No LC50Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date Water Depth 11
Sky: U No Pass? O Yes No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND HIDRAULICS RE( ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

LHe
gth: Description:

MUDDATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT

Smpl W.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer MudCompany

PIl #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

IDIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE

HPERATIONS SUM WIARY
ME Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0600 Time St mmary

Activity Daily Cum.
1. Mob/DeMob
2. Cement
3. Circulate
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U.I N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA
13. P.U./L.D.Pipe
14. R/U; R/D
15. RigRepair
16. Run Casing
17. Service Rip
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other

Total
Total Bours

Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulk Material on Board Previous Cost $3,500Daily Daily Gals ement: sx Daily CostCum. Cum. Gals arite: sx Cum. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
no ' Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract a O E§. Date on Location Saud Date Repert Date

Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC#2-1 Union #7 Sep 1. 2004

MR TVJ Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Compa ty Representative

$937,000 8,700' Carl Hulslander

Present ODeration Rig Phone: Toolousher

Waiting on Rock for County Road Rig Fax: David WIIcox

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: ast BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes O No LC50Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass?
_

Yes No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth LinerTop MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED ANDH/DRAULICSREt ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

BitRemarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROl Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV Speed SPM Pump #1 Pum Purn #3

ggs DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

BHA
Length: Description:

MUDDATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT

Smpi P.L
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

I #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt MudCI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD TVD ANGLE VS

OPERAT ONS SUilMARY
IAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0600 Time St mmary
Activity Daily Cum.

1. Mob/DeMob
2. Cement
3. Circulate
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt.ILOT
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. RIU; RID
15. Rig Repair
16. Run Casing
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO

RECEIVED
2245

Ream
26. Well Control

DECI 1 2M 27 *°°
28. Other

r - o .

Total
Total dours s ÛMO

Rig Dcantime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board revious Cost $3,500

Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx affyCost
Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx um. Cost



PPI MSC Exploration
ne Daily Drilling Report

Block,Lease and WellNo. Contract Rio p_QL QFR Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date
Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC #2-1 Union #7 Aug 31, 2004

MD T_VB Footage AFE No. AFEAmount Auth. TD. Company Repregentytive
$937,000 8,700' Galan Williams

Present Operation Rig Phone: Toolousher
Watering County Road Rig Fax: David WIIcox

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes O No LC50 Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? O Yes Contractor ext BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: U No Pass? O Yes No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth LinerTop MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED AND H /DRAULICSRE( ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth In Footage Hrs WOB Rm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump Pressures
No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4
1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2
2 14 x S.5 4.37 3/4

LHe
gth: Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT

Smpl F.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

PIl #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI DailyCost CumulativeCost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
ANGLE

OPERAT ONS SUMMARY
TliAE Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0600 Time St mmary

Activity Daily Cum.
1. Mob/DeMob
2. Cement
3. Circulate
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OHLogging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt.lLOT
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./LD. BHA
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D
15. Rip Repair
16. Run Casing
17. Service Rig
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other

Total
Total lours

Rig DONntime Fuel Usage Bulk Materialon Board Previous Cost $3,500Daily Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily CostCum. Cum. Gals Barite; sx Cum. Cost



MPPI MSC Exploration b ML.
Daily Drilling Report

Block.Lease and WellNo. Contract RIa 996 9.21 Date on Location S and Date Reoort Date

FloyCanyon Wildcat - State MSC #2-1 Union #7 Aug 30, 2004

gg Tyg Footaqa AFE No. AFFAmount Auth. TD. Compa ly Representative
$937,000 8,700' Galan Williams

Present Operation Rig Phone: Toolousher

Watering County Road Rig Fax: DavidWilcox

Current Weather DONR Visit NPDES People on Loc: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS

Wind: O Yes U No LC50 Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft

Seas: Problem7 O Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft

Sky: U No Pass? O Yes No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth LinerTop MWwhen LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?

Conductor

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED ANDHIDRAULICSRE( ORD
BIT Bit Type and Total Avg Grade

No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT. Hrs PU Wt SO Wt ROT Wt Torque

Pump
Slow Pump Pressures

No. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3

gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2

2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

BHA
Length: Description:

MUD DATA
WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS% LGS% OIL% SD% MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf

PIT

smpl l-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud Company

#1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt MudCI DailyCost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SUkVEYS
MD VS

OPERATIONSSUE1MARY
ME Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:

0600 0600 Time St mmary
Activity Daily Cum.

1. Mob/DeMob
2. Cement
3. Circulate
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. Drill Cmt./LOT
11. N.U./N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA
13. P.U.lL.D. Pipe
14. R/U;RID
15. Rig Repair
16. Run Casing
17. Service Rip
18. Sidetrack Op.
19. Stuck Pipe

.

20. Survey
21. Trips .
22. Tst. BOPs

RECCivEu s..
26. Well Control

DECI a y 27.WOC
28. Other

OlynF nit. ,.s
, .

Totai

Total dours i *M (kW
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage ulkMaterial on Board Previous Cost $3,500

Daily Daily Gals ement: sx Daily Cost

Cum. Cum. Gals arite: sx Cum, Cost



PFI MSC Exploration
Daily Drilling Report

Blaçk, Lepse and WellNg. Contract Riq QQL DE§ Date on Location Soud Date Reoort Date
Floy Canyon Wildcat - State MSC #2-1 Union #7 Aug 29, 2004

MD g Footage AFE No. AFE Amount Auth. TD. Company Representative
$937,000 8,700' Galan Williams

Present Operation Rig Phone: Toolpushêr
BuildingLocation Rig Fax: David WIIcox

Current Weather DONRVisit NPDES People on Loc.: Last BOP Test Date RIG ELEVATIONS
Wind: O Yes No LC50 Sample Date Operator RKB 15 ft
Seas: Problem? Yes Contractor Next BOP Test Date Water Depth ft
Sky: No Pass? O Yes No Service RKB-CHF ft

CASING RECORD
Casing String OD Wt. Grade Conn. Jts. Run Setting Depth Liner Top MW when LOT

MD TVD MD TVD Run Pres EMW Leakoff?
Conductor

BIT, WEIGHT, SPEED ANDH /DRAULICS RE(ORD
BIT BitType and Total Avg Grade
No Size Manufacturer Serial Number Jets Depth in Footage Hrs WOB Rgm ROP Tooth Bearing Gage

Bit Remarks: Cum. ROT.Hrs PU Wt SO Wt RO'r Wt Torque

Pump Slow Pump PressuresNo. Stroke X Liner Output SPM GPM Pressure JV Pb AV S eed SPM Pum #1 Pum #2 Pum #3
gps DC DP 1/4

1 9 x 6 3.15 1/2
2 14 x 5.5 4.37 3/4

L
nAgth:

Description:

MUD DATA

WT. VIS PV YP GELS WL HTHP CAKE SLDS % LGS % OIL % SD % MBT pH Pm Pf/Mf
PIT

Smpi |-.L.
Chlorides Ca++ Temp Temp Shaker Screens Hours Mud Engineer Mud CompanyPÑ #1 #2 Desand Cent.

#3 #4 Desilt Mud CI Daily Cost Cumulative Cost

DIRECTIONAL SURVEYS
MD VS

GPERATIONS SUM WIARY
Time Boats: Supply Boat Name: Status:

FROM TO HOUR Code Crew Boat Name: Status:
0600 0600 MIRU Neilson Construction. Building location and digging reserve pit Time SLmmary

8/26/04 through8/29/04 Activity Daily Cum.
1. MoblDeMob
2. Cement
3. Circulate
4. Directional Work
5. Drilling
6. Drive Pipe
7. Fishing
8. OH Logging
9. Lost Circ.
10. DrillCmt./LOT
11. N.U./ N.D.
12. P.U./L.D. BHA
13. P.U./L.D. Pipe
14. R/U; R/D
15. Rig Repair
16. Run Casing
17. Service Rig
18. SidetrackOp.
19. Stuck Pipe
20. Survey
21. Trips
22. Tst. BOPs
23. UR/HO
24. W.O.W.
25. Wash & Ream
26. Well Control
27. WOC
28. Other

TotalTotal lours
Rig Downtime Fuel Usage Bulk Material on Board Previous CostDaily Daily Gals Cement: sx Daily Cost $3,500Cum. Cum. Gals Barite: sx Cum. Cost



NOTICE

Utah Oiland Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-21 states that,

> A well is considered completed when the well has been adequately worked to be capable
of producing oil or gas or when well testing as required by the division is concluded.

* Within 30 days after the completion or plugging of a well, the following shall be filed:
• Form 8, Well Completion or Recompletion Report and Log
• A copy of electric and radioactivity logs, if run
• A copy of drillstem test reports,
• A copyof formation water analyses, porosity, permeability or fluidsaturation

determinations
• A copy of core analyses, and lithologic logs or sample descriptions if compiled
• A copy of directional, deviation, and/or measurement-while-drilling survey for

each horizontal well

Failure to submit reports in a timelymanner willresult in the issuance of a Notice of Violation
by the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, and may result in the Division pursuing enforcement
action as outlined in Rule R649-10, Administrative Procedures, and Section 40-6-11 of the
Utah Code.

As of the mailing of this notice, the division has not received the required reports for

Operator: MSC EXPLORATION LP Today's Date: 08/02/2005

Well: API Number: Drilling Commenced:

SEE ATTACHED LIST:

No monthly drilling reports since 12/2004

To avoid compliance action, required reports should be mailed within 7 business days to:
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Ifyou have questions or concerns regarding this matter, please call (801) 538-5284.

cc: Well File
Compliance



·

Location API Spud Spud Lease
Operator Twp-Rng-Sec Well Name Number Date - Dry Date - Rotary Type

MSC EXPLORATION,LP 210S 200E 16 STATE MSC 16-1 4301931401 05/14/04 05/17/04 State
MSC EXPLORATION,LP 2108 190E 35 STATE MSC 35-1 4301931404 07/27/04 State
MSC EXPLORATION,LP 210S 180E 02 CACTUS ROSE MSC 2-1 4301931402 09/09/04 State
MSC EXPLORATION,LP 210S 200E 02 N THOMPSON 2-1 4301931412 10/29/04 State
MSC EXPLORATION,LP 2108 190E 26 FEDERAL MSC 26-1 4301931407 11/08/04 11/12/04 Federal

NO WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG RECEIVED FOR THE FEDERAL MSC



MSC EXPLOftATION, L.P.
16ô00 IMPERIAL VALLEY DR., SUITE 3ôO

HOUSTON, TEXAS 770GO

PHONE. 161-931-8933 F AX: 281-931-8655

FACSIMILE TRANSMITTAL SHEET

TO FROM:

COMPANY DATE:

FAX NUMBER: . TOTAL NO. OF PAGES INCLUDING COVER:

PHONß NUMBER SENDER'S REFERENCE NUMBER;

RE: YOUR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RECEIVED
OCT19 2005

DMOFOIL,GAS&



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONAhlDSERIALNUMBER.

6 IF INDIAN. ALLOTTEE OR TRIBENAME
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

T UNITor CA AGAEEMENTNArÆ
Oo *101 use this fc m for propusais to drillnew wnlis,signlilcaniyasepenexistingwells bolow carrer:tbollomatoledepth, reanter plugged wells, orto

d'S hor.zortal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLfamiforsuch proposals.

1. TYPEOF WE..L ret & WELLNAMEandNUMBER
OIL WELL GAS WELL 13] OTHER

2 NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER

3. A3DSESS OF OPERATOR: PHONENUMBER: 10 F1ELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

A LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESA' SURFACE:

QTRIOTR,SECTICN. TOWNSHIP,RANGE,WER:DIAN: STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXESTO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOT!CE OF INTENT
(Submilin Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE REAT SIDMCOO mR WELL

Apç:roximate cate work will slast: NEW CONSTRUCTroN TEW.PORARILY ABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS UNS OPERATOR CHANGE TUUNGREPNR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR MRE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUGBACK WATER DISPOSAL
Subrni!010iralFormOmly)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) O WATER SHUT-OFF
Daleof wolkCompletion.

O COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATION OR WELL SITE OTHOL

O CONVERTWEl.LTYPE RECOMPI.ETE- DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinentdetails includingdates, depths, volumes, etc.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) n a TITLE

(This space for State use only)

RECElVED
5/2000)

(SeeInstructionsonReverseSide) OCT19 2005

Div.0FOlL,GAS&M



00NFllENTIAL
STATE OF UTAH AMENDEDREPORT FORM 8DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES (hlghlight changes)

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING S LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER

8 IFJNDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRISENAMEWELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG g A
la TYPEOF WELL:

µA LL L DRY OTHER 7 UNITorCA AGAEEMENTNAME

b TYPEOF WORK'
8 WE NAMEanc NUMBERNE\ H SIZ. DENEP-O BRY R OTHER

2. NAMEOFOPERATOR 0 APIMUMBER

3. AODRESSOF OPERATOR So 5 A ¿ PHONENUMBER: 10 FIELDANDPCOL. OR WILDCAT

68er>¾ ertelÑale Dr.R:saa moooo 6849343932 alidost4. LOCATIONCF WELL{F TAGES) 11 QTRIQTR.SECTION, TOWNSHIP. RANGE.
AT SURFACE. ) O SL MERIDIAN

AT TOP PRODUCINGINTERVA'. REPORTED BELOW

12. COUNTY 13 STATAT TOTAL3EPTH

Ng g UTAH
4. DATE SPUDDED 16 DATE T D. REACNED 16 DATECCMPLETED 17. ELEVATIONS(OF. RKB,RT.GL):

ABANDONED READY TO PRODUCE
16. TCTAL DEPTH MD 19. PLUGBACK TO MD 20, IF MULTIPLE COMPLETIONS,HOW MAN • 21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD

PLUGSET:TVD TVD TVD
22. TYPE ELECTRICANDOTHER MECHANICAL LOGSRUN (Submitcopy ofeach) / 23.

WASWELL CORED7 NO YES (Submitanalysrs)
WASDST RUNT NO YES (Sem )
DIRECTIONALSURVEY? NO YES (Submitcopy)

2A CASING ANDLINER RECORD (Roport all strings set In wel)

HOLESIZE Sl2EJGRADE WEIGHT (#Jft ) TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD)
STAGE MENTER CNEO

CF
SACKES

VO M BBL) CEMENTTOP ** AMOUNTPULLED

25. TUBINGRECORD

DEPTHSET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKERSET (I/D)

26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD
FORMATIONMAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) TOP (TVD) 30TTOM (TVD) INTERVAL (TopíBot- MD) SIZE MO HOLES PERFORATION STATUS

(C)
Open eed

(D)
Open Samed

28. ACID, FRACTURE,TREATMENT, CEMENTSODEEEE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERvAL AMOUNT ANDTYPEOF MATERIAL

29. ENCLOSEDATTACHMENTS: 30. WELLSTATUS:

O ELECTRICALIMECHANICAL LOGS GEOLOGICREPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONAL SURVEY

O SUNDRY NOTICEFOR PLUGGINGANDCEMENTVERIFICATION CORE MSIS OTHER

(5/2000) (CONTINUED ON BACK) DEC13 2005

DIVOFOIL,GAS&MIN



31. INITIAL PRODUCTION WITERVAL A (As shown in item226)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED TEST DATE: HOURSTESTED TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL PROD METMOD
RATES: -a

CHOKESIZE: TEG PRESS CSG. PRESS. APi GAAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL-BBL GAS- MCF: WATER- BBL INTERVAL STATUS
RATES: -+

INTERVALB (As shown in items20)

DATE FIRST PRODUCEC TEST DATE: HOURSTESTED TEST PRODUCTION OIL-BBL; GAS- McF WATER - BBL PROD.METHOD
AATES -+

CHCKESIZE TBG PRESS CSG PRESS. APl GRAVITY BTU-GAS GASIOIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION CIL - BBL GAS- MCF WATER - BBL INTERVALSTATUS
RATES -

INTERVALC (As shown In item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED TEST DATE HOURS TESTED TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: S- MCF WATER -- BBL ROD.METHOD
RATES: -+

CHOKESIZE TBS PRESS CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY STU- GAS GASIOILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL S-MCF WATER- BBL IMTERVALSTATUS
RATES: -

INTERVAL D (As shown in Item #26)

DATEFJRST PRODUCED TEST DATE RS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER- DDI. PROD METHOD
RATES -+

CHOKE SIZE TBG PRESS CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY U- GAS GASICILRATLO24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BOL: INTERVALSTATUS
AATES' -+

32. DISPOSITION OF GAS(Soki, Used for Fuel, Vonted, Etc.)

33. SUMMARYOF POROUSZONES (incinde Aquifem): 34. FORMAT30N(Log) MARKERS:
Showall imparant zones of porosity and contents thereof Cored inIervals and all drill-slem lesis, including depth inlanal
lesied. cush.on used, lime 1001open, 11emnngand shu1•n pressunes and recoverics.

Formation Descripilons, Contents, etc. Name
(f Dep:h)

35. ADDITIONALREMARKS(include plugging procedure)

36. themby certify that the foregoing and atiached information is complete and carrect as determined from all avullable records.

NAME PLEASE PRINT) TITLE / /) (3

SIGNATURE DATE /O-- --Û,

This report must be submitted within 30 days of
• completingor plugging a new well e reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
• drilling horizontal laterals from an existingwel bore • significantly deepening an existingwell bare below the previous bottom-hole depth
• recompleting to a different producing formation • drilling hydrocarbon exploratoryholes, such as core samples and stratigraphictests

* ITEM 20: Showthe number of CompÏetionsif production is measured separately from two or more formations.

** ITEM24: Cement Top - Show how reported top(s)of cement were determined (circulated(CIR), calculated (CAL). cement bond log (CBL), tempera u f ÑE DSend to: Utah Division of Oil,Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538·5340
1594 West North Temple. Suite 1210
Box145801 Fax: 801-359-3940 DEC13 2005Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(&2000, DNOF0\L,GAS&



STATE OF UTAH AMENDEDREPORT FORM 8
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES (highlight changes)

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER:

ML 47721

WELL COMPLETIONOR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

la. TYPE OF WE O LLL
LL DRY OTHER 7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF WORK 6. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

gL
Z EP- R

RY
FS

O Î L Û8CtUS Rose MSC 2-1

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

MSC Exploration 4301931402
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT

1645 Court PI. #300 an Denver STATE CO z 80202 (303) 468-0656 WILDCAT
4. LOCATIONOF WELL(FOOTAGES) 11. QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE.

MERIDIAN:
ATSURFACE: 1110 FSL, 495 FEL NWSW 2 21S E
ATTOP PRODUCING INTERVALREPORTED BELOW 1110 FSL, 495 FEL

12. COUNTY 13. STATE
AT TOTALDEPTH: 1110 FSL, 495 FEL GRAND UTAH

14. DAX7SÊ0DDED: 15 TE7T R CHED: 16
y ABANDONED READYTO PRODUCE

17 ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL):

18. TOTALDEFTH: MD 6,850 19. PLUG BACKT D: MD 6,850 20 IF MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS, HOW MANY?* 21 DEPTH BRIDGE MD 5,015
PLUG SET:

TVD 6.850 TVD 6,850 Tvo 5,015
22. TYPE ELECTRICANDOTHER MECHANICALLOGS RUN (Submit copy of each) 23

WAS WELLCORED? NO YES (Submit analysis)
DLUMDL/DSN/SDL/SUGR - DIPMETER

WAS DST RUNT NO YES (Submit report)
Dual Induction DIRECTIONALSURVEY7 NO YES (SuW m)

24. CAsiNG AND IJNER RECORD (Report all abings set in weN)

HOLE SIZE SIZEIGRADE WEIGHT (#lft) TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) STAGE CEMHENTER CN
FSC VO CEMENT TOP ** AMOUNTPULLED

16 1236 LP 0 20 SURF
12 8 5/8 K55 24 0 525 525 A 300 SURF 10000

7 7/8 5 1/2 LSO 17 0 6,850 4,216 G 1,190 266 3310 102000

26. TUBINGRECORD

SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

2 7/8 4,837 4.837
26. PRODUCING WHERVAl-S 27. PERFORATION RECORD

FORMATIONNAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM(TVD) INTERVAL(Top/Bot - MD) SIZE NO. HOLES PERFORATION STATUS

(A) Wingate 6,330 6,664 6,330 6,664 6,509 6,518 .43 36 om O Squed

(B) Winaate 6,330 6,664 6,330 6,664 6,320 6,342 .43 88 om O Squed

(c) Entrada 5,087 5,429 5,087 5,429 5,094 5.104 .43 40 open Squed

(D) Moab 4,926 5,087 4,926 5,087 4.921 4,931 .43 40 open O Squed

28. ACID, FRACTURE, 1REATMENT, CEMENT SOUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNTANDTYPE OF MATERIAL

6509' - 6518' 25 Bbis Fe Acid 7.5% Fe Acid. w/ 2 G Halh85M, 2 a Penn 1085, 2 G Lourf300, 50 G Fer Chek ®.
6320' - 6342' 1000 Gals 7 1/2% Fe Acid 2 Gal Hel 85, 10 Gals Scale Check Lo 55

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

O ELECTRICAUMECHANICALLOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONALSURVEY TEMP SI
O SUNDRYNOTICE FOR PLUGGINGANDCEMENTVERIFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER:

(5/2000) (CONTINUEDON BACK)

MAYOf



31. INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVALA (As shown in ilun #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL PROD METHOD:
RATES: -•

CHOKE SIZE: . PRESS CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU-GAS GASIDILRATlO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

INTERVALB (As shown in llam 826)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD METHOD:
RATES:

CHOKE SIZE: BG. PRESS CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GASK)ILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBC GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

INTERVALC (As shown in llam #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD METHOD:
RATES: -+

CHOKE SIZE: BG. PRESS CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GASIOILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: ->

INTERVALD (As shown in item 826)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL PROD METHOD:
RATES: -+

CHOKE SIZE: BG. PRESS CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS ASIOILRATIO24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -*

32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

Tempory SI
33. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES (include AqulFers): 34. FORMAT10N(Log) MARKERS:

Show allimportant zones ofporosity and contentsthereot Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushionused, time tool open, flowing and shuldn pressures and recoveries.

Formation Descriptions, Contents, etc Name (Measurd Depth)

Mancos Shale 296
Dakota Silt 3.872
Dakota Sandstone 4.062
Moab Tonaue 4.926

Entrada 5,087
Navaio 5,577
Wingate 6,330
Chinie 6,664

36. ADDIT10NALREMARIO (include plugg tg procedure)

Well Shut-in waiting on completionrig for completion of upper producing zones. CIBP @6450'; RBP @6273' &5015'

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is compieleand correct as determined from all available records.

MAME(PIJËASE PRINT E.

D

/1e7n/2006

This report must be submitted within 30 days of
e completing or plugging a new well • reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
e drillinghorizontal laterals from an existing well bore • significantlydeepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
e recompleting to a different producing formation • drillinghydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from twoor more formations.

" ITEM24: Cement Top-Show how reported top(s)of cement were determined (circulated (CIR),calculated (CAL),cement bond log (CBL),temperaturesurvey (TS)).

Send to: Utah Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801



CACTUS ROSE 2-1
API # 4301931402

1,110' FSL & 495' FEL

þggg 10/17/2004

Depth survey
506 2.00
1007 2.00
1497 3.75
2019 3.75
2514 3.75
3011 3.25
3522 2.00
4016 2.00
4507 5.5
4650 5.0
4830 4.0
5014 3.0
5324 1.0
5788 1.75
6272 2.5
6577 2.25
6790



STATEOFUTAH FORM5
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

DESIGNATION OF AGENT OR OPERATOR

The undersigned is, on record, the holder of oil and gas lease

LEASE NAME:

LEASE NUMBER:

and hereby designates

NAME: Tidewater Oil & Gas LLC 090

ADDRESS: 1645 Court Place, Suite 301

city DENVER state CO , zip 80202

as his (check one) agent G I operator G, with full authority to act in his behalf in complying with the terms of the lease and
regulations applicable thereto and on whom the Division Director or Authorized Agent may selve written or oral instructions in
securing compliance with the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules and Procedural Rules of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining
of the State of Utah with respect to:

(Describe acreage to which this designation is applicable. Identify each oil and gas well by API number and name. Attach additional pages as
needed.)

APPROVED2/dildo
43-019-31408 STATE MSC 35-2
43-019-31394 STATE 1-32
43-019-31399 STATE 21-19 (32-16D) d M° •

43-019-31404 STATE MSC 35-1 Division of Oil, Gas an mmg
43-019-31412 N THOMPSON 2-1 Earlene Russell, Engineering Techocian

DS 6 #ÀsW MD ~TM.SE WEL 5 - (g
it is understood thatthisdesignation of agent/operator does not relieve the lessee of responsibility for compliance with the terms
of the lease and the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules and Procedural Rules of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining of the
State of Utah. It is also understood that this designation of agent or operator does not constitute an assignment of any interest in
the lease.

In case ofdefault on the partof the designated agentloperator, the lessee willmake fulland prompt compliance withall rules, lease
terms or orders of the Board of Oil, Gas and Miningof the State of Utah or its authorized representative.

The lessee agrees to promptly notifythe Division Director or Authorized Agent of any change in this designation.

Effective Date of Designation: 10/10/2006

By: (Name) Mic OF: (Company) MSC Exploration, LP

(Signature) (Address) 369 Florida Hill Rd.

(Title) President RIDGEFIELD

(Phone) (203) 994-1079 RECElVED ,,,ge CT gig 06877

(5/2000)
DCT2 5 2006

DDLOFOLGAS&





2007-Feb-23 04:41 PM Encana Oil & Gas (USA) 7208763710 1/3

facsimilecoversheet I
Ifax:

370 17thStreet,Sulta1700
Denver,co 80202

Date: 2/23/2007 No, at'Pages: (includingcover) 3

To:
Name Company Fax

JimJones Tidewster 435.250.8601

Telephone No.: 720.876.5361

I Message:
ToWhomitMayConcent
Enclosedisa faxforJimJones, Jimis currentlystayingatyourhoteL

- this forminthecorreatspace.Onceyou havedoneso,pleasefax Itto:
01.359. : DustinDoucet

needstobe doneby5 o'clocittoday.Titankyouforyourhelp.

Oscar

pleasehanm• Omr---= O --=== Omr--
Ow-••- O »•o-.-t O -a O --.

Call Oscar at 720.876.5801.
Ifpmblemsareencounteredwiththistransmission.

The inlemnifontranomaledis inlandedonlytar thepersonor enuly lo whichI is adessued andmay containconidenialandlerprMIegedmitirla!.AnylovleW, 19Dansmisalon,disseminaionM otheruseofof laldngany80MODIn tellence an, thipInibrmallonby pomons« eniDesother thantheintendedreelplentis pmhlbRed.IfyoureceivedthisInawa,pleasecontactie senderand deletethemaledallinenanycomputer,



TIDEWATER OIL & GAS COMPANY LLC
1645 Court Place, Suite 301 Denver, Colorado 80202 (303) 468-0656

Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114 July 12, 2007

RE: Reclaimed MSC pits in Grand County, Utah

Cactus Rose MSC 2-1

Gentlemen,

Cactus Rose MSC 2-1 -

This pit has not been closed, and Tidewater has removed much of the excess fluid on the

pit. Approximately half of the pit is dry, while the other ½ of the pit has a very small

amount of water collected from seepage and weather.

Tidewater proposes to begin covering the pit by filling in the dry side of the pit at this

time. The side with water will be reduced in size and the remaining water removed. The

pit should dry out with the hot weather that has been experienced, and the remaining

portion of the pit closed in approximately 1 month, after the fluid has evaporated from the
soils. Tidewater will have S&S (435-564-3291) remove the accumulated liquidsfrom the

pit during the first week. Tidewater will monitor the pit so that it can be closed at the

earliest possible time.

Additional work is being considered on this well, but the existing pit will not be utilized

for any flow back water from completion stimulations. Attached is a chemical analysis

of the water in the pit taken July 9, 2007 after water had been removed and evaporation

had occurred. Tidewater doesnot want to close this pit before the soils have dried
sufficiently to prevent any contamination by the wet soils floating to surface during
closing.

Contact me if you have any questions at 303-808-5672 or James Jones, Manager

Tidewater Oil & CompanyLLC at (303) 468-0656 ext 201.

Thank you

RAtt
ch : at r a alysis, current pit picture RECEIVED

JUL 1 1 2007



HALLIBURTON
Halliburton Energy Services
The Rockies NWADistrict Laboratory

Grand Junction, CO 970) 523-3692

Water Analysis Report

Contact Information

Company Tide Water and Oil &Gas Date Received July 10, 2007

Reported To Roger Knight Date Tested July 10, 2007

Reported By Deba Shafiee Tested By Ann Ekx

Sample 1 Physical Characteristics

Well Name Temperature 77 °F

Location pH 73

Specific Gravity 1.059 Color Black

Corrected SG 1.062 at 60°F Turbidity Severe

TOS (calculated) _ 132512 ppm Resistivity 0.09 Q•m

Sample 1 Chemical Characteristics

Anions Chloride 73500 mg/L Cations Total Iron 0.0 mg/L

Sulfate 0 mg/L Ferrous Iron 0.0 mg/L

Bicarbonate 500 mg/L Potassium 50900 mg/L

Carbonate 0 mg/L Calcium 8200 mg/L

Hydroxide mg/L Magnesium 1400 mg/L

Sodium (calculated) 5830 mg/L

NOTICE: This report is for information only, and the content is limited to the sample described. Halliburton makes no warranties, expressed or

implied, as to the accuracy of the contents or results. Any user of this report agrees Halliburton shall not be liable for any loss or damage,

regardless of cause, resulting from the use hereof.

General Comments

¯Šamplewas filtered prior to the testing for clarity.

RECEIVED
JUL 172007

DNOFOIL,GAS&
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. DJJ

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 2/12/2008

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N3000-Tidewater Oil & Gas Company, LLC N3440-NAE, LLC

110 16th St, Suite 1200 16800 Imperial Valley Dr, Suite 380
Denver, CO 80202 Houston, TX 77060

Phone: 1 (303) 327-7134 Phone: 1 (281) 931-8933

CA No. Unit: CACTUS ROSE

WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

CACTUS ROSE MSC 2-1 02 210S 180E 4301931402 14306 State OW S
CACTUS ROSE 36-43-2217 36 220S 170E 4301931535 16184 State OW PA
CACTUSROSE 16-11-2118 16 210S 180E 4301931546 16416 State OW DRL

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 2/26/2008

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 2/22/2008
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 1/15/2008
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 6666480-0161

4b. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: ok
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM not yet BIA

7. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: not yet

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: n/a

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 2/27/2008
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 2/27/2008
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 2/27/2008
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 2/27/2008
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: n/a
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: 2/27/2008

BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: UTB000296
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: n/a
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 8030575893
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: 2/22/2008

The Division sent response by letter on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a
COMMENTS:

NAE Cactus Rose FORM A.xis



STATE OF UTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GASANDMINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRISE NAMESUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS
7, UNITor CAAGREEMENTNAME:Do notuse thisformfor proposals todrillnewwells,significantlydeepen existingwallsbelow currentbottom-holedepth, reenterplugged wells,or to

drillhorizontallaterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLformforsuchproposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEandNU BER:OILWELL Q GAS WELL OTHER
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
NAE, LLC S Ò

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL,OR WILOCAT:
16800 Irnperial Valley Dr. Ste. 380 HOUSTON

STATE TX ,,77060 (281) 931-8933
A LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: COUNTY:

QTRIQTR, SECTION,TOWNSHIP,RANGE,MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

« CHECKAPPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHERDATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ^ci rze O DEEPEN REPERFORATECURRENTFORMATIONO NOTICEOF INTENT
(Submitin Dupilcate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximatedate workwillstart; CASINGREPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUSPLANS OPERATORCHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENTREPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUGBACK WATERDISPOSAL(Submit OriginalFormOrdy)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUTOFFDate of work completion:
O COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER:

O CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE- DIFFERENTFORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details includingdates, depths, volurnes, etc.

NAE, LLC willbe assuming all plugging and reclamation liabilitiesfor the wells on the schedule attached hereto.

Effective Date: 2/12/08

Federal Bond Number: UTBOOO296
State Bond Number:8030575893

Name: Ti water Oil&Gas C mpany LLC. Address: 110 16th St., Ste 1200, Denver, CO 80202

Signatu :

Title:

Date:

SNAME(PULEASEPRINT) TITLE fÎ...

(ThisspaceforStateuseonly) RECENED

APPROVED Ñ /A / 02
(5/2000)

FEB22 2003

Division of Oil,GasandMining
""°"""' DN.0F01., Og gaWNG

Earlene Russell, Engineering



State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER
ExecutiveDirector

Division of Oil Gas and Mining
JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.

Governor JOHN R. BAZA
Division Director

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

September 29, 2008

CERTIFIED MAIL NO.: 7004 2510 0004 1824 6343

Mr. Walter Lowry
North American Exploration, LLC
110 16* Street, STE# 1220
Denver, CO 80202

Re: State 21-19 (32-16D) API 43-019-31399: State MSC 16-1 API 43-019-31401;
Cactus Rose MSC 2-1 API 43-019-31402; State MSC 35-1 API 43-019-31404;
N Thompson 2-1 API 43-019-31412
Extended Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned Requirements for Wells on Fee or State Leases

Dear Mr. Lowry:

North American Exploration, LLC has five (5) Mineral Lease Wells (see Attachment A)
that are currently in non-compliance for extended shut-in and temporary abandonment (SI/TA)
status. It is understood that a couple of these wells have been or will be plugged shortly. Wells
SI/TA beyond twelve (12) consecutive months require the filing of a Sundry Notice in
accordance with R649-3-36-1 for Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining ("Division") approval.
Wells with five (5) years non-activity or non-productivity shall be plugged, unless the Division
grants approval for extended shut-in time upon a showing of good cause by the operator (R649-
3-36-1.3.3).

For extended SI/TA consideration the operator shall provide the Division with the following:

1. Reasons for SI/TA of the well (R649-3-36-1.1).

2. The length of time the well is expected to be SI/TA (R649-3-36-1.2), and

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone(801) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • wwwogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS &



Page 2
September 29, 2008
Mr. Lowry

3. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well has
integrity, meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition, static fluid level,
pressure, existence or absence of Underground Sources of Drinking Water and
other factors do not make the well a risk to public health and safety or the
environment (R649-3-36-1.3)

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity and may help
qualify your well for extended SI/TA. Note: As of July 1, 2003, wells in violation of the SI/TA
rule R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-1-4.2, 4.3).

1. Wellbore diagram,and

2. Copy of recent casing pressure test, and

3. Current pressures on the wellbore (tubing pressure, casing pressure, and
casing/casing annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity, and

4. Fluid level in the wellbore, and

5. An explanation of how the submitted information proves integrity.

If the required information is not received within 30 days of the date of this notice, further
actions will be initiated. If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me at
(801) 538-5281.

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

JP/js
Enclosure

cc: Jim Davis, SITLA
Compliance File
Well



Attachment A
Lease

Well Name API Type Years Inactive

1 STATE 21-19 (32-16D) 43-019-31399 ML-47441 4 Years 11 Months

2 STATE MSC 16-1 43-019-31401 ML-46760 3 Years 9 Months

3 CACTUS ROSE MSC 2-1 43-019-31402 ML-47721 2 Years 9 Months

4 STATE MSC 35-1 43-019-31404 ML-47576 3 Years 5 Months

5 N THOMPSON 2-1 43-019-31412 ML-46759 3 Years 10



State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STY LER
JON M.HUNTSMAN, JR. Executive Director

oovemor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GARY R. HERBERT JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Govemor Division Director

February 23, 2009

CERTIFIED MAIL NO.: 7005 0390 0000 7507 4238

Mr. Walter Lowry
North American Exploration, LLC
110 16thStreet, STE# 1220
Denver, CO 80202

Subject: SECOND NOTICE: Extended Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned Requirements for
Wells on Fee or State Leases

State 21-19 (32-16D) API 43-019-31399; State MSC 16-1 API 43-019-31401;
Cactus Rose MSC 2-1 API 43-019-31402; State MSC 35-1 API 43-019-31404;
N Thompson 2-1 API 43-019-31412

Dear Mr. Lowry:

North American Exploration, LLC ("NAE") has five (5) Mineral Lease Wells (see
Attachment A) that are currently in non-compliance for extended shut-in and temporary
abandonment (SI/TA) status. Wells SI/TA beyond twelve (12) consecutive months require the
filing of a Sundry Notice in accordance with R649-3-36-1 for Utah Division of Oil, Gas &
Mining ("Division") approval. Wells with five (5) years non-activity or non-productivity shall be
plugged, unless the Division grants approval for extended shut-in time upon a showing of good
cause by the operator (R649-3-36-1.3.3).

Based on a sundry dated February 13, 2008 it was understood by the Division that NAE
would be "assuming all plugging and reclamation liabilities" for the above listed wells. The N
THOMPSON 2-1 well had a sundry dated July 18, 2008 with intent to plug and abandon (P&A).
Condition of approval to P&A was sent to NAE July 22, 2008. The STATE 21-19 (32-16D) also
had a sundry dated August 22, 2008 with intent to P&A. Condition of approval to plug this well
was sent September 3, 2008. A notice of SI/TA status for wells listed (Attachment A) was sent
via certified mail September 29, 2008. To date the Division has no record of the proposed work
being done on these wells, nor received any such correspondence addressing the issue. Please
address this matter promptly.

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple,Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 •facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • www.ogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS &



Page 2
North American Exploration, LLC
February 23, 2009

For extended SI/TA consideration the operator shall provide the Division with the
following:

1. Reasons for SI/TA of the well (R649-3-36-1.1).
2. The length of time the well is expected to be SI/TA (R649-3-36-1.2), and
3. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well has

integrity, meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition, static fluid
level, pressure, existence or absence of Underground Sources of Drinking
Water and other factors do not make the well a risk to public health and safety
or the environment (R649-3-36-1.3)

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity and may help
qualify your well for extended SI/TA. Note: As of July 1, 2003, wells in violation of the SI/TA
rule R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-1-4.2, 4.3).

1. Wellbore diagram, and

2. Copy of recent casing pressure test, and

3. Current pressures on the wellbore (tubing pressure, casing pressure, and
casing/casing annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity, and

4. Fluid level in the wellbore, and

5. An explanation of how the submitted information proves integrity.

If the required information is not received within 30 days of the date of this notice, a
notice of violation will be issued. If you have any questions concerning this matter, please
contact me at (801) 538-5281.

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

DKD/JP/js
Enclosure
cc: Jim Davis, SITLA

Compliance File
Well File

N:\O&G Reviewed



Attachment A

Lease
Well Name API Type Years inactive

1 STATE 21-19 (32-16D) 43-019-31399 ML-47441 5 Years 3 Months
2 STATE MSC 16-1 43-019-31401 ML-46760 4 Years 2 Months
3 CACTUS ROSE MSC 2-1 43-019-31402 ML-47721 3 Years 2 Months
4 STATE MSC 35-1 43-019-31404 ML-47576 3 Years 10 Months
5 N THOMPSON 2-1 43-019-31412 ML-46759 4 Years 3



O
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISlON OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

ML-47721
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use thisform for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells,or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1.TYPEOFWELL 8.\NELLNAMEandNUMBER:
OlL WELL GAS WELL / OTHER CACTUS ROSE MSC 2-1

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

NAE LLC 4301931402
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

110 16TH ST., STE 1220 DENVER , CO 480202 (303) 327-7169 WILDCAT
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1110 FSL, 495 FEL COUNTY: GRAND

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWSW 2 21S 18E 2 STATE:

UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO 1NDUCATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBlNG REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:
3/5/2007

CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

2/25/2007 Set ClBP @ 3200', perf Mancos 3045-55'
2/26/2007 Frac Mancos 3045-55 w/ 70Q N2 foam, 111,000 lbs 20/40 frac sand
3/3/2007 flow test well
3/4/2007 Shut in well

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Mark Grummon TITLE Exec VP

SIGNATURE DATE 8/21/2009

(This space for State use only) gy CENEU

AUS2 62003

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



STATEOFUTAH FORMS
DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator: NAE, LLC Operator Account Number: N

Address: 110 SIXTEENTH ST, SUITE 1220

city DENVER

state CO zip 80202 Phone Number: (303) 327-7169

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng county
4301931402 CACTUS ROSE MSC 2-1 WSvi 2 21S 18E GRAND

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

9/10/2004

Comments: Recompleted in the Mancos formation on 3/5/2007

Well 2

API Number Well Name QQ See Twp Rng County
4301931595 SVA 23-33-2119 NWSW 33 21S 19E GRAND

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

9!30/2008

comminits
*

' COMPLETE WELL INTHE WINGATE FORMATION

Well 3

API Number Well Name QQ See Twp Rag County
4301931672 CRU 31-24-2218 SESW 31 228 18E

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spad Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

A 4/25/2008 )

ACTION CODES:
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) Vi ryyy
B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unit well) Name Please P t)
C - Re-assign well from one existingentity to another existingentity
D - Re-assign well from one existingentity to a new entity Signature

5 - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) fx «c ¿/ pg
Title Oati

(5/2000)

RECEIVED
SEPO2 2009

OlV.0F0lL,GAS&



State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER
GARY R. HERBERT Executive Director

Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GREGORY S. BELL JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Governor Division Director

February 22, 2011

Certified Mail No. 7004 1160 0003 0190 4857

DIVISION ORDER

North American Exploration, LLC ¶ $ $6 i38C Grove Street
Richfield, CT 06877

Subject: Division Order to Plue and Abandon the Cactus Rose MSC 2-1, Cactus Rose
16-11-2118, SVA 23-33-2119 and State MSC 35-1 wells operated by North
American Enerev, LLC

To Whom It May Concern:

The Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (the Division) received notice of North American
Exploration, LLC (NAE) Chapter 7 Bankruptcy, District of Delaware (Case 10-13199) on
January 12, 2011.

Due to the bankruptcy the Division is concerned with NAE's future ability to continue
operating within the legal and financial constraints of the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation Act.
NAE is required to be able to meet its duty to plug each dry or abandoned well, prevent waste or
pollution, and maintain and restore each well site (Utah Code §40-6-5 and rule R649-3-1.2).

The Cactus Rose MSC 2-1, Cactus Rose 16-11-2118, SVA 23-33-2119 and State MSC35-1 wells are all currently in shut-in status. In addition, these wells are in noncompliance with
Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-36 (Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned Wells).

The Division is hereby ordering NAE to Plug and Abandon the Cactus Rose MSC 2-1
(API 43-019-31402), Cactus Rose 16-11-2118 (API 43-019-31546), SVA 23-33-2119 (API 43-
019-31595) and State MSC 35-1 (API 43-019-31404) wells.

The wells shall be plugged in accordance with R649-3-24. Within 30 days of receipt of
this order NAE shall submit notices of intent sundries, for Division approval, to plug and
abandon each well.

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT84114 -5801

telephone (801) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • wwmogm.utah.gOV OIL, GAS &



Page 2
North American Exploration, LLC
February 22, 2011

Therefore, NAE has 30 days from receipt of this Order to enter into an agreement for
execution of the Order.

NAE has the right to appeal the Division Order by filing to the Board of Oil, Gas and
Mining a request for review according to procedures set forth in R649-10-6. A request for review
of a Division Order must be filed with the secretary to the Board, Julie Ann Carter (801) 538-
5277, within 30 days of issuance of the order.

In the event NAE does not respond to the Division Plugging and Abandonment Order,
within 30 days of receipt, the Division will file for a formal hearing before the Board of Oil, Gas
and Mining, as described in the Utah Administrative Code R641, requesting a Board Order to
plug and restore the well sites. Should this matter be brought before the Board, the Division will
seek bond forfeiture (R649-3-1.16) and liability for plugging costs in excess of bond forfeiture
amounts (R649-3-1-4).

Questionsregarding this order may be directed to Clinton Dworshak, Compliance
Manager at (801) 538-5280 or Dustin Doucet, Engineer, at (801) 538-5281.

Sincerely,

Clinton Dworshak
Compliance Manager

CLD/js
cc: John Rogers, Associate Director

Steve Alder, Assistant Attorney General
Dustin Doucet, Engineer
Randy Thackeray, Lead Auditor
LaVonne Garrison, SITLA
Bill Kreussling, NAE, LLC
Michael S. Cornish, MSC Exploration
James Jones, Tidewater Oil and Gas
United States Bankruptcy Court
Compliance File
Bond File
Well



State of Utah
- DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER

GARY R. HERBERT Executive Director

Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GREGORY S. BELL JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Govemor Division Director

October 25, 2011

Certified Mail 7010167000148103133

Dodie Lilley
Wells Fargo Bank
MAC T5916-011
21314 Kuykendahl Road
Spring, TX 77379

SUBJECT: Claim Against CDs 9398350612, 9398350620, 9398350596 and 9398350604
issued by Wells Farao Bank, as Surety on behalf of NAE, LLC, as Principal

Dear Ms. Lilley:

This letter serves as a claim against the referenced CDs by the Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining ("the Division"). North American Exploration, LLC aka NAE, LLC
("NAE") is the operator of record for the SVA Unit 23-33-2119 Well (API 43-019-31595);
Cactus Rose MSC 2-1 (API 43-019-31402); State MSC 35-1 (API 43-019-31404) and Cactus
Rose 16-11-2118 (API 43-019-31546) ("the wells"). NAE has defaulted on conditions set forth
in the referenced bond as follows: (bond copies attached)

"NOW THEREFORE, if the above bound principal shall comply with all of the
provisions of the laws of this State, and the rules and regulations and orders of the Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining of the State of Utah, including, but not limited to the proper plugging of
said well(s), and filing with the Division of the State, all notices and records required by said
office, then this obligation is void, otherwise the same shall be in full force and effect."

NAE has failed to reply to or comply with our demands for compliance with the
Shut-in/Temporarily Abandoned Well Requirements and Notice of Violation ("NOV") letters
regarding noncompliance with Division Rule R649-3-36, Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned
Wells. A Division Order to plug the well was dated February 22, 2011. Copies of those letters
and the return receipts are available upon request.

The Division has reviewed the Utah Division of Corporations and Commercial
Code concerning the whereabouts of NAE without success.

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City,UT 84114 -5801

telephone (80 I) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801)538-7458 • www.ogm.utah.gOV OIL, GAS &



Page Two
Wells Fargo Bank
October 25, 2011

NAE filed Chapter 7 Bankruptcy on January 12, 2011; the Trustee's
Abandonment of Estate Property for the wells dated July 15, 2011 and August 24, 2011 are
attached. Alyse Aruch representing the Chapter Trustee sent authorization to release the CDs to
the Division dated September 20, 2011. Therefore, the Division has concluded that NAE is
defunct as the operator of the wells and that the wells have been abandoned.

The Board of Oil, Gas and Mining ("the Board") has ordered the CDs be claimed
to resolve the matter. The Division therefore requests Wells Fargo to surrender of the CDs along
with any accrued interest payable to the "State of Utah, Division of Oil, Gas & Mining" to plug
the wells and reclaim the well locations. Upon receipt of certified funds, Wells Fargo is hereby
relieved of responsibility to protect the funds for the Division

Due to the presence of potential environmental hazards at the well site, the
Division appreciates your prompt attention to this matter. If you have any questions, please
contact Dustin Doucet, Petroleum Engineer at (801) 538-5281 or John Rogers, Associate
Director - Oil and Gas Program at (801) 538-5349.

hn R. Baza
/Director

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

Attachments (5)
JRB/jr/rt/er

cc: James T. Jensen, Board Chairman (via e-mail)
Steve Alder, Assistant Attorney General (via e-mail)
Alyse M. Aruch, McCarter & English (via e-mail)
John Rogers, Associate Director (via e-mail)
Dustin Doucet, Petroleum Engineer (via e-mail)
LaVonne Garrison, SITLA (via state mail)
NAE, LLC Certified Mail 70101670000148103140
Bond File
Well Files

N://OG Reviewed Docs/ER/Bonds/NAE



RELEASE

WHEREAS, NAE, LLC ("Operator"), as principal and Wells Fargo Bank ("Bond Agent"), as
bond, issued Certificates of Deposits (CDs) numbered 9398350612, 9398350620, 9398350596 and
9398350604 in the aggregate amount of One Hundred Fifty Thousand Dollars ($30,000,$60,000,
$30,000,$30,000;totaling $150,000)on November 25, 2009 in favor of the State of Utah, which CDs
provided the State some assurance that certain wells would be plugged pursuant to the rules and
regulations of the State of Utah.

WHEREAS, The State of Utah has made a demand on the operator and bond numbers under
the referenced bond, claim number 222-15 in the amounts totaling $150,000,pursuant to the terms of
the bonds.

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the payment of One Hundred Fifty Thousand and
no Dollars ($150,000),the State of Utah fully discharges and releases the bonds of any and all claims,
whether known or unknown, relating to the obligation stated within the terms of the bonds. This
release shall take full force and effect only upon receipt of certified funds by the State of Utah of the
payment in the amount totaling $150,000,referenced above.

SIGNED AND SEALED this 25th day of October, 2011.

THE STATE OF UTAH
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING:

John R. Baka, Director
STATE OF UTAH )

) ss:
COUNTY OF SALT LAKE )

On the 25th day of October 2011, personally appeared before me, John R. Baza, who being
duly sworn did say that he, the said John R. Baza, is the Director of the Division of Oil, Gas and
Mining, Department of Natural Resources, State of Utah, and he duly acknowledged to me that he
executed the foregoing release by authority of law on behalf of the State of Utah.

Notary Public/
Residing at: SC

My Commission Expires:
PENNYBERRY

NOTARYPUBUC - STATEOF UTAH
MyComm. Exp. 01/04/2015

Commission #



IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE

In re: :
: Chapter 7

NORTH AMERICAN EXPLORATION, LLC :
: Case No. 10-13199 (PJW)

Debtor. :
: Related Docket No. 43

ORDER GRANTING CHAPTER 7 TRUSTEE'S ABANDONMENT OF ESTATE PROPERTY

Upon consideration of the Proposed Notice of Abandonment of Estate Property (the

"Notice") of the Chapter 7 Trustee for the entry of an order abandoning the estate property

known as (1) Cactus Rose MSC 2-1 (API# 43-019-31402) ML 47721, (2) State MSC 35-1 (API#

43-019-31404) ML 47576, and (3) Cactus Rose 16-11-2118 (API# 43-019-31546) ML 47575

(the "Property"); and it appearing' that the Court has jurisdictionover this matter; and it

appearing that notice of the Notice was sufficiently provided, and that no other or furthernotice

need be provided; and it further appearing that the relief requested in the Notice is in the best

interestof the bankruptcy estate;and uponall of the proceedings had beforethe Court; andaûer

due deliberationand sufficient cause appearing therefore,it is hereby

ORDERED that the Property is herebyabandoned; and it is further

ORDERED that the Chapter 7 Trustee is authorized and empowered to take all actions

necessary to implement the relief granted in thisOrder; and it is further

ORDERED that this Court shall, and hereby does, retain jurisdictionwith respect to all

matters arising from or in relation to the implementationof this Order.

Dated: 2011

The Honorable Peter J. Walsh
United States Bankruptcy Judge

ME1



McCARTER
&ENGLISH

ATTORNEYSATLAW

September 20, 2011

VIAE-MAILAND US MAIL

Steven F. Adler
Assistant Utah Attorney General
1594 West North Temple St. #300
Salt Lake City, Utah 84118

Re: In re North American Exploration, LLC
Chapter 7, Case No.: 10-13199 (PJW)

AlyseM.Aruch
Assoäte Dear Mr.Adler:
T.973.849.4157
F.973.624.7070
aaruch@mocarter.com As you know, this Firm represents Charles A. Stanziale, Jr. as the Chapter Trustee

(the "Trustee") to North American Exploration, LLC (the "Debtor") in the above-
referenced bankruptcy case. The Debtor is the designated operator of the oiland
gas wells set fodh below, each of which is located in Utah (the "Wells").

McCarter&English,LLP
FourGatewayCenter The Trustee understands that as operator, the Debtor is responsible for plugging
100MulbenyStreet and restoring the well site for each Well. The Trustee is aware thatprior to filingits
y 7

4°$02-4056
bankruptcy petition, the Debtor provided the Utah Division of Oil Gas &Mining(the

F.973.624.7070 "DÍVISion") with celtain Certificates of Deposit (the"CDs") to be held by Wells Fargo
ww.mocarter.com Bank as bonds to secure the plugging and abandonment of the Wells as required by

Utah state law. The amount and account number for each CD is set forth below.
On February 22, 2011 the Division issues a DivisionOrder requiringthe plugging of
the Wells. The Trustee has not and willnot be taking any steps to plug theWells.

Wel_I Account Number Amount
BOSTON

SVA Unit #23-33-2119 #9398350612 $30,000
HARTFORD State MSC 35-1 #9398350620 $60,000

NEWYORK Cactus Rose MSC 2-1 #9398350596 $30,000

Cactus Rose 16-11-21182 #9398350604 $30,000
NEWARK

On July 15, 2011 and August 24, 2011 the Bankruptcy Court entered twoorders
PHILÁDELPHIA (the"Abandonment Orders") approvingthe Trustee's abandonment of theWells.

The Abandonment Orders authorized the Trustee to take any and all necessary
action to implement the abandonment of the Wells.

STAMFORD

WILMINGTON

ME1



September 20, 2011
Page 2

Pursuant to the Division Order and theAbandonment Orders, the Trustee hereby
authorizes the Division to instruct Wells Fargo Bank to release the CDs to the
Division.

Very trul yours,

Alyse M. Aruch

ME1



FILED
OCT13 2011

StevenF. Alder (00033)
Emily Lewis (13280)
Assistants Utah Attorney General
1594 West North Temple St. #300
Salt Lake City, Utah 84118
Telephone801 538 5348

BEFORE THE BOARD OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

STATE OF UTAH

IN THE MATTER OF THE DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS,AND MINING'S NOTICE OF
AGENCY ACTION FOR AN ORDER FINDINGS OF FACT,
FORFEITINGTO THE STATE OFUTAH CONCLUSION OF LAW,
ALL INTEREST IN THE CERTIFICATES AND ORDER
OF DEPOSIT #9398350612, #9398350620,
#9398350596,AND #9398350604BEING Docket No. 2011-016
HELD BY WELLS FARGO BANK FOR
AND ON BEHALF OF THE STATE OF CauseNo. 222-15
UTAH AS SURETY FOR THE PLUGGING
AND ABANDONMENT OF THE
FOLLOWINGWELLS OPERATED BY
NORTH AMERICAN EXPLORATION,
LLC: SVA UNIT #23-33-2119, STATE MSC
35-1, CACTUS ROSE MSC 2-1, AND
CACTUSROSE 16-11-2118; ALL IN
GRAND COUNTY, UTAH

The foregoingtitled Notice of Agency Action (NAA) filed by the Utah Division of Oil

Gas & Mining, ("Division") seeking an Order of the Board requiring that North American

Exploration proceed to forfeit the bonds provided for the purpose of plugging the wells and a

reclaiming the well sites, and other relief came on for hearing on Thursday, September 29, 2011

at a regularly scheduled meeting of the



The Followingmembers of theBoardwere present and participated in thehearing:

Ruland J. Gill, Jr., Kelley L. Payne, Charles D. Hansen, Carl F. Kendell, and James T. Jensen,

Chairman. Michael Johnson, Assistant Attorney General represented the Board. Division

employees, ClintonDworshak, and Earlene Russell provided testimony and presented evidence

in support of the NAA. The Division was represented by StevenF. Alder, Assistant Utah

Attorney General. No persons appeared on behalf of the Respondent, North American

Exploration or any other party in opposition to the NAA. The Board heard the testimonyand

reviewed the pleadings and exhibits presented and being fully apprised of the premises makes the

following,

FINDINGSOF FACT

1. North American Exploration, LLC a/kla NAE, LLC ("NAE") is a Delaware

corporation qualified to do business in Utah.

2. NAE is the designated Operator of the following oil and gas wells drilled at the

following locations in Grand County, Utah:

SVA Unit #23-33-2119 Section 33 Township 21 S, Range 19 E, SLM

State MSC 35-1, Section 35 Township 21 S, Range 19 E, SLM

Cactus Rose MSC 2-1, Section2, Township 21 S, Range 18 E SLM,and

Cactus Rose 16-11-2118 Section 16,Township21 S, Range 18E, SLM.

3. NAE as Operator is responsible to plug the wells and restore the well sites for each of

theabove wells.

4. NAE as operator provided to the Division Certificatesof Deposit (CDs) to be held by

Wells Fargo Bank as bonds to secure the plugging and abandonmentof the wells as required by



Utah code §40-6-5(2)(f)(2011) and Utah Admin. Code R649-3-1(1), in the amounts and for the

wells as shown below:

SVA Unit #23-33-2119 #9398350612, $30,000.00;

State MSC 35-1, #9398350620, $60,000.00;

Cactus Rose MSC 2-1, #9398350596, $30,000.00;and

Cactus Rose 16-11-21182. #9398350604, $30,000.00.

5. For each CD provided to the Division as a bond for the costs of plugging and restoring

the well site, NAE through its authorized agent executed a Collateral Bond agreement on the

Division's form 4B which provides that the CD's is payable to the Director of the Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining as agent of the State of Utah unless the well is properly plugged and well

site restored.

6. For each CD provided to the Division as a bond, the Division was provided a Time

Account Receipt/Disclosure (identifyingthe number and amount of the CD and indicatingit is to

be automatically renewed), a Time Account Maintenance Request, (indicating that the Payee is

the director of the Utah Division of Oil Gas and Mining), a Time Account Detail (indicatingthat

the CD are subject to a Hold), and a Hold Detail (indicatingthe Hold does not expire and that

written authorization is required to remove the restraint).

7. NAE has filed a voluntary petition under Chapter 7 of the United States Bankruptcy

code, in the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware on October 1, 2010.

8. On February 22, 2011 the Division issued its Division Order requiring the plugging of

the subject wells as required by the rules.



9. As a result of the filing of its voluntary Chapter 7 bankruptcy and the abandonmentby

the bankruptcytrustee of any interest in the wells for which the CD's are being held, the

Operator NAE is without financial means to conduct plugging and site restoration.

10. NAE, as the operator; the bankruptcy trustee on behalf of NAE; and Dawn Trucking

as assignees have not responded to the Division Order to plug the wells and restore the sites and

have otherwise refused to plug the sites despite having the opportunity to do so.

11. On September 20, 2011 the bankruptcytrustee advised counsel for the Division by

letter that it had abandoned all interest in the wells and any claims to the CD's and has

authorized the Division to instruct Wells Fargo Bank to release the CD's to the Division.

CONCLUSIONS OF LAW

1. Proper and adequatenotice of the hearing on the Division's NAA was given to North

American Exploration d/b/a NAE, as operator; to the bankruptcytrustee on behalf of the operator

and interests of the bankruptcy estate, if any; to Wells Fargo Bank as holder of the CD's, to

Dawn Trucking Company as assignee; and to all other persons who may be entitled to notice

under the rules of the Board.

2. NAE as Operator is responsible to plug the wells and restore the well sites for each of

the above wells.

3. The Operator has refused and due to the bankrupt status is otherwiseunable to

complete plugging of the wells and reclamation of the well sites.

4. It is necessary and appropriate that the Board order that the followingCertificatesof

Deposit which were provided as surety for the plugging of the wells and reclamation of the well

sites be forfëited to the Division:



Well CD Amount

SVA Unit #23-33-2119 #9398350612, $30,000.00;

State MSC 35-1, #9398350620, $60,000.00;

CactusRose MSC 2-1, #9398350596, $30,000.00;and

Cactus Rose 16-11-21182. #9398350604, $30,000.00.

5. It is appropriate and necessary that upon request by the Director that Wells Fargo Bank

deliver to the Division the full face value of amount for each CD as shown above to be used by

the Division to plug the wells and restore the sites as required by the Division's rules.

6. The Division is obligated to use the forfëited funds to effect the plugging ofthe wells

and the restoration of the sites to the standards required by the Division's rules.

NOW THEREFORE, IT IS HEREBY ORDEREDAS FOLLOWS:

1. The following Certificates of Deposit and any accrued interest held by WellsFargo

Bank and provided as surety for the plugging of the listed wells and reclamation of the well sites

are ordered forfeited to the Division:

Well CD Amount

SVAUnit #23-33-2119 #9398350612, $30,000.00;

StateMSC 35-1, #9398350620, $60,000.00;

Cactus Rose MSC 2-1, #9398350596, $30,000.00;and

CactusRose 16-11-21182. #9398350604, $30,000.00.

2. The Division is Ordered to use all amounts forfeited to plug the above identifiedwells

and reclaim the well sites to the standards required bythe law.



3. The Divisionis authorizedto make demand and to takeany and all actionsnecessary

to complete the forfeitureof the bonds, recovery of the amountsheld as surety, and to effbet the

proper plugging of the wellsand restoration of the well sites.

Dated this y of October,2011

STATE OF UTAH
BOARD OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

Jam s T. Jensen, Ch
1 4 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah 34116



CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that I caused a true and correct copy of the foregoingFINDINGS OF
FACT, CONCLUSIONS OF LAW, AND ORDER for Docket No. 2011-016, Cause No. 222-15
to be mailed with postage prepaid, this ifTA day of OCToArr , 2011, to the following:

North American Exploration, LLC Debra Olson
38 C Grove Street clo Opus Oil &Gas, LP
Ridgefield, CT 06877 16770 Imperial Valley Dr

Houston, TX 77060-3400
Michael S. Johnson [Undeliverable]
Assistant Attorneys General
Utah Board of Oil, Gas & Mining Charles A. Stanziale
1594 West North Temple, Suite 300 Trustee in Bankruptcy
Salt Lake City, UT 84116 100 Mulberry Street
[Via Email] Four GatewayCenter

Newark, NJ 07102
Steven F. Alder
Assistant AttorneysGeneral Alyse Arach
Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining McCarter &English, LLP
1594 West North Temple, Suite 300 405 N. King St., Suite # 800
Salt Lake City, UT 84116 Wilmington, DE 19801
[Via Email]

Wells Fargo Bank
Annie D. Murphy Attn: Debra Hemandez
Counsel for Dawn Trucking Company, 2352 North Belt
Inc. 12941 I-45N
DUFFORD, WALDECK, MILBURN & Houston, TX 77060
KROHN, LLP
744 Horizon Court Michael S. Cornish
Grand Junction, CO 8 1506 369 Florida Hill Rd.

Ridgefield, CT 06877
Dodie Lilley
Wells Fargo Bank Charles Duffy
MAC T5916-011 16800 Imperial Valley Dr, Suite 380
21314 KuykendahlRd Houston, TX 77060
Spring, TX 77379 [Undeliverable]

Debra Olson
16800 Imperial Valley Dr. Suite 380
Houston, TX 77060
[Undeliverable]



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

Docket Number: Board: X Division:
Cause Number:
WELL NAME API  NO ENTITY

NO
LEASE TYPE WELL 

TYPE
WELL
STATUS

CACTUS ROSE 16-11-2118 16 210S 180E 4301931546 16416 State OW S
CACTUS ROSE MSC 2-1 02 210S 180E 4301931402 14306 State GW S
STATE MSC 35-1 35 210S 190E 4301931404 14259 State GW S
SVA 23-33-2119 33 210S 190E 4301931595 17247 State OW S

 

DATA ENTRY:
1.    Date bond received on: 12/20/2011
2.    Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 11/30/2012
3.    Date RBDMS changed to "Calimed" on: 12/20/2011
COMMENTS:  
Per the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining well(s) moved to N9999 Orphan-No Resonsible Operator for Division plugging.

SEC  TWN  RNG

N9999-Orphan-No Responsible OperatorN3440- NAE, LLC
TO: ( New Operator):

 Operator Name Change/Merger

2011-016
222-15

    The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 12/20/2011
FROM: (Old Operator):

ORPHAN-NO RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR 
CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only)

NAE, LLC.xls  12/20/2012

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ORPHAN-NO RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR
CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only)

Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 12/20/2011

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N3440- NAE, LLC N9999-Orphan-No Responsible Operator

Docket Number: 2011-016 Board: X Division:
Cause Number: 222-15
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

NO TYPE STATUS
CACTUS ROSE 16-11-2118 16 210S 180E 4301931546 16416 State OW S
CACTUS ROSE MSC 2-1 02 210S 180E 4301931402 14306 State GW S
STATE MSC 35-1 35 210S 190E 4301931404 14259 State GW S
SVA 23-33-2119 33 210S 190E 4301931595 17247 State OW S

DATA ENTRY:
1. Date bond received on: 12/20/2011
2. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 11/30/2012
3. Date RBDMS changed to "Calimed" on: 12/20/2011
COMMENTS:
Per the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining well(s) moved to N9999 Orphan-No Resonsible Operator for Division plugging.

NAE, LLC.xls



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ORPHAN-NO RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR
CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only)

Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 12/20/2011

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N3440- NAE, LLC N9999-Orphan-No Responsible Operator

Docket Number: 2011-016 Board: X |Division:
Cause Number: 222-15
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

|NO | |TYPE | STATUS |CACTUSROSE 16-11-2118 16 210S 180E 4301931546 16416 State OW S
CACTUS ROSE MSC 2-1 02 210S 180E 4301931402 14306 State GW S
STATE MSC 35-1 35 210S 190E 4301931404 14259 State GW S
SVA 23-33-2119 33 210S 190E 4301931595 17247 State OW S

DATA ENTRY:
1. Date bond received on: 12/20/2011
2. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 11/30/2012
3. Date RBDMS changed to "Calimed" on: 12/20/2011
COMMENTS:
Well(s) moved to N9999 Orphan-No Resonsible Operator for plugging.

NAE, LLC.xls


	APD-DRILL
	APD-WORKSHEET
	APD-APPROVAL
	SPUD
	WCR
	WCR
	OPERATOR-CHG
	SUNDRY-RECOMPLETE
	OPERATOR-CHG

	OPERATOR-CHG



