
Sch<x>lan.d InstitutiorLGË
TRUST LANDSADMINISTRATION

675 ËËast500 South, Sulle 500

olenes.walker SaK Lake City, Utah 64102-2818

Gnvorner 801-538-5100

Kevin S. Cm ter
801-355-0922 (Fax)

Director hitpanrms.trustlands.com

May 4, 2004

MID-POWER RESOURCES CORPORATION
3753 HOWARD HUGES PARKWAY
SUITE 200
LAS VEGAS, NV 89109

RE: Banding Requirement Changes
Effective: February 24, 2004

Dear Sir or Madam:

Effective February 24, 2004, School and Institutional Trust Lands Administration ("TLA") entered
into an agreement with the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining ("DOGM") to transfer to DOGM the
responsibility of maintaining a sufficient performance bond to plug each dry or abandoned Well,
repair each well causing pollution, and maintain and restore each well site, if necessary. In the
past, operators have been required to post bonds in varlous amounts with TLA to cover their
operations on lands owned and administered by TLA; with DOGM if the company had operations
on fee lands in Utah; and, still another, if its operalions were on federal lands. Under our new
agreement with DOGM, TLA willno longer require operators to post a plugging and reclamation
bond with this office. All plugging and reclamation bonds for operations on TLA lands or fee
lands will now be administered by DOGM under theirrule R649-3-1, as revised July 1, 2003. \f
you currently have a bond in place with DOGM, please check with their office as it may be
sufficient to cover operations on trust lands and no additional bond may be required. The DOGM
rules can be viewed and bond forms can be downloaded from the DOGM website at
http://ogm.utah.qovloilqas.

Operators will be required, however, to post a performance bond in the amount of $5,000per
well or $15,000 statewide with TLA to cover lease obligations on TLA lands not otherwise
covered by the DOGM bond. Delinquent or unpaid royalties would be examples of deficiencies
that could be remedjed by the bond. The surety sources are the same as set out in TLA's
current rules at R850-20-2800.

Your company has 120 days from lhe date of this letter or until September 1, 2004, to verify and
update your bonding to come into compliance with the new rules. Should you need assistance or
have compliance questions, please contact the following people for help:

At TLA -- Ed Bonner (801/538-5151 or edbonner@utah.gov)
At DOGM -- Earlene Russell (801/538-5336 or earlenerussell@utah.gov)

As soon as TLA is provided evidence by your company that: (1) it has sufficÍent bonding with
DOGM to cover plugging and reclamation operations: (2) your company has no outstanding
obligatlons with TLA that would be remedied by your bond, and, (3) your company provides
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Mid-Power Resource Corporation
B290 West Sahara Avenue. Suite 186
Las Vegas, Nevada 89117
702-8384/16 Fax 702-838.5087

August 25, 2005

Mr. Keri Clarke
Ý!cePresident - Land
Marion Energy inc.
119 South Tennessee, Suite 200
McKinney,Texas 75069

Re: Clear Creek Unit - Carbon/Emery Counties, Utah

Dear Mr. Clarke:

Mid-Power Resoume Corporation, as operator of the Clear Cmek Unitlocated inCarbon/Emery Counties, Utah, hereby, authorizes and empowers Marion Energyinc. to act as a designated agent on its behalf.

As designated agent, MarionEnergy ino, shall handle all operational matters
relating to the Clear Creek Unit and shalt deal directly withall State and Federalregulatory agencies in Utah (USDA Forest Service, BLM,and the DOGM) onsuch operational matters.

This authorization is in accordance with the terms and conditions outlinedin theFarmout and ExplorationAgreement entered into on February 22, 2005 by andbetween Mid-Power Resource Corporation and Marion Energy loc.

Sincerely,

James W. Scott
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MID.
POWER

RESOURCE CORPORATION

April 17, 2006

Diana Whitney
State of Utah
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Re: Directional Drilling R649-3-11

Ridge Runner #8-19: 1513.92ft FSL 1735.94ft FWL /SW/4 Section 20 14S-7E (Surface)
2211ft FNL 747ft FEL /NE Section 19 14S-7E (bottom hole)
Emery County, UT

Dear Ms. Whitney

Pursuant to the filing of Mid-Power Resource Corporation's Application for Permit to Drill the above
referenced well on January 5* 2006, we are hereby submitting this letter in accordance with Oil and Gas
Conservation Rule R649-3-11 pertaining to the exception to location and Siting of wells.

• The Ridge Runner #8-19 well is located within the Clear Creek Federal Unit Area.

• Mid-Power Resource Corporation is permitting this well as a directional well in order to maximize
drainage of the reservoir in a topographically challenging area.

• The concept of drilling Multiple directional wells from a single pad site will allow Mid-Power
Resource Corporation to minimize surface disturbance that would be otherwise cause by two or
more separate pad sites. Mid-Power Resource Corporation plans to Drill 3 directional wells from
this pad site.

• Mid-Power Resource Corporation hereby certifies that it is the sole working interest owner within
460 feet of the entire directional well bore.

Therefore, based upon the above information Mid-Power Resource Corporation requests the permit be
granted pursuant to R649-3-11.

Sincerely,

Benjamin Evans
Landman
Marion Energy Inc.
(Agent for Mid-Power Resource Corp.)

8290 West Sahara Avenue, Suite 186, Las Vegas, Nevada, 89117
Telephone: (702) 838-0716, Fax: (702)
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STATEOFUTAH FORM3
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING AMENDED REPORT
(highlight changes)

5. MINERALLEASE NO: 6. SURFACE:
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL USA-U-01740 Federal

1A. TYPE OF WORK: DRILL REENTER DEEPEN
7. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

8. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
B. TYPE OF WELL: OIL GAS 2 OTHER SINGLE ZONE MULTIPLEZONE Clear Creek Unit

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.WELLNAMEandNUMBER:
Mid-Power Resource Corporation Ridge Runner # 8-19
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
8290 W. Sahara, # 186 CITY Las Vegas STATE NV zie 89117 (702) 838-0716 g gg
4. LOCATIONOF WELL(FOOTAGES)(Qggg 3720 Ÿ '7 f . | 11.MERR/QTARN:SECTION,TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

ATSURFACE: 1735.94ft FWL 1513.92ft FSL ISWl4 Section 20 14S-7E NESW 20 14S 7E
AT PROPOSED PRODUCINGZ E: 747ft FEL 2211 ft FNL/ËSection 19 14S-7E

14. DISTANCE lN MILESAND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR PUST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:

Approx 4 miles South West of Clear Creek and approx 9 miles South of Scofield Emery
UTAH

15. DISTANCE TO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE(FEET) 16. NUMBEROF ACRES IN LEASE: 17. N JMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:

Surface 1735.94ft Bottom Hole 747ft 1208.99 40
18. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING,COMPLETED, OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:

APPLlED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET)
Surface 20ft Bottom Hole 2767ft 5,870 See Attached Bond Document

21. ELEVATIONS(SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATE DATE WORK WLL START: 23. ESTIMATEDDURATION:

9815' GR 7/1/2006 30 days

24. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE CASING S1ZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY,YlELD, AND SLURRY WElGHT

14 3/4 10 3/4 J-55 40.5 500 Premium "G" 420 sks 1.25 cuft/sk 14.2 ppg
9 7/8 7 5/8 J-55 26.4 3,350 Lead: Prem. Lite 310 sks 3.82 cuft/sk 11 ppg

Tail: 50/50 Poz 75 sks 1.25 cuft/sk 14.2 ppg
7 7/8 5 1/2 J-55 17.0 7,150 Lead: Prem. Lite 488 sks 3.82 cuft/sk 11 ppg

Tail: 50/50 Poz 275 sk 1.25 cuft/sk 14.2 ppg

25. ATTACHMENTS

VERIFYTHE FOLLOWINGARE ATTACHED INACCORDANCE WITHTHE UTAHOIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES:

WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLINGPLAN

EV1DENCEOF DIVISIONOF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANY OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Keri CI e TITLE VP Land

S1GNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

Ut
API NUMBERASStGNED

(See instructions

DAPPROVALide)

Federal Approval of thia(11/2001)

ACfÌOn is
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n i Location:
A ŒR E ŒSE The well locotion was determined using a Trimble 5700

GPS survey grade unit.
Basis of Bearing:

(S89°55'W
- 5272.08') The Basis of Bearing is GPS Measured.

(WEST - 5020.62 )
N89°56'39"E

- 2638.72' GLO Bearing·
The Bearings indicated ore per the recorded plat obtained
from the U.S. Land Office.
Basis of Elevation·
Basis of Elevation of 10452 being at the Southeast Section
Corner of Section 7, Township 14 South, Range 7 East,
Salt Lake Base and Meridian, as shown on the Candland Mountain
Quadrangle 7.5 minute series map.

Descri tion of Location·
Surface cation
Proposed Drill Hole located in the NE/4 SW/4 of Section 20,
T14S, R7E, S.L.B.&M., being 1513.92' North and 1735.94' East
from the Southwest Section Corner of Section 20, T14S, R7E,
Salt Lake Base & Meridian.

UTM Target Location
NT82559 Proposed Target located in the SE/4 NE/4 of Section 19,
E 84925 T14S, R7E, S.L.B.&M., being 2211.00' South and 747.00' West

from the Northeast Section Corner of Section 19, T14S, R7E,
Salt Loke Base & Meridian.

4 (TARGET)
¯¯ Surveyor s Certificate:

LZ.00' - I, Albert J. Spensko, a Registered Professional Land Surveyor,

09 holding Certificate 146652 State of Utah, do hereby certify that
---- the information on this drowing is a true and occurate survey

based on data of record and was conducted under my personal
direction and supervision as shown hereon.

°o N 382087 /* ""* %
z E 485682 | '¾ '

735.9&'
CALc. (SURFACE) o. 46 52

e -RIDGE RUMER Al ask#8-\9
,

' TALON RESOURCES,INC.
ELEV: 9814.3 195Nerth10tWestP.O.Box1230

Fhens(435)S7-5310Fu(435)@7·5311
FÆstitalmenety.net

Marion Energy Inc.

Legend (WEST - 5035.14') (N89°58'W
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O Drill Hole Location NOTES:
Ridge Runner #8-19

1. UTMond Latitude Lon itude Coordinates
Sections 19&20, T14S, R7E, S.L.B.&M.

Metal Cap (Found) are derived usina a PS Pathfinder and are Emery County, Utah
shown in NAD 27 Datum. om., ,

e,,,,, e,

Brass Cap (Searched for, but not found)
N. BUTK VICH LW.J./A.J.S.

Calculated Corner
AR CLEONG ARGULONG GRAPHIC SCALE g/06

) GLO
59°35'24.976"N 39°35'40.240"N
lil°\0'00.266"W lil°IO'32.0Al"W ( IN MT ) 1 = 1000'

GPS Measured | 1 inch = tooo rt. ..., y ,, 4

n i Location:
A ŒR E ŒSE The well locotion was determined using a Trimble 5700

GPS survey grade unit.
Basis of Bearing:

(S89°55'W
- 5272.08') The Basis of Bearing is GPS Measured.

(WEST - 5020.62 )
N89°56'39"E

- 2638.72' GLO Bearing·
The Bearings indicated ore per the recorded plat obtained
from the U.S. Land Office.
Basis of Elevation·
Basis of Elevation of 10452 being at the Southeast Section
Corner of Section 7, Township 14 South, Range 7 East,
Salt Lake Base and Meridian, as shown on the Candland Mountain
Quadrangle 7.5 minute series map.

Descri tion of Location·
Surface cation
Proposed Drill Hole located in the NE/4 SW/4 of Section 20,
T14S, R7E, S.L.B.&M., being 1513.92' North and 1735.94' East
from the Southwest Section Corner of Section 20, T14S, R7E,
Salt Lake Base & Meridian.

UTM Target Location
NT82559 Proposed Target located in the SE/4 NE/4 of Section 19,
E 84925 T14S, R7E, S.L.B.&M., being 2211.00' South and 747.00' West

from the Northeast Section Corner of Section 19, T14S, R7E,
Salt Loke Base & Meridian.

4 (TARGET)
¯¯ Surveyor s Certificate:

LZ.00' - I, Albert J. Spensko, a Registered Professional Land Surveyor,

09 holding Certificate 146652 State of Utah, do hereby certify that
---- the information on this drowing is a true and occurate survey

based on data of record and was conducted under my personal
direction and supervision as shown hereon.
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Drilling Plan
Mid-Power Resource Corporation

Ridge Runner 8-19

1. Geologic Surface Formation
a. Quaternary

2. Estimated Tops

Name TVD TD Production Phase
Top of Emery 1875ft 1893ft Gas
Top of Blue Gate 3050ft 3337ft Gas
Top of Ferron 5164ft 6211ft Gas
TD 5864ft 7162ft

3. Casing Program

a. See Form #3 Section 24.

4. Operators Specifications for Pressure Control Equipment

a. 2000 psi WP Double Gate BOP or Single Gate BOP (Schematic Attached).

b. Functional test daily.

c. All casing strings shall be pressure tested (0.2psi/footor 1500 psi, whichever is greater)
prior to drilling the plug after cementing; test pressure shall not exceed the internal yield
pressure of the casing.

d. All ram-type preventers and related control equipment shall be tested at the rated
working pressure of the stack assembly or at 70 percent of the minimum internal yield
pressure of the casing, whichever is less. Tests shall be done at the time of installation,
prior to drilling out, and weekly. All testes shall be for a period of 15 minutes.

5. Auxiliary Equipment

a. Kelly Cock - Yes

b. Float at the bit - No

c. Monitoring Equipment on the mud system - visually

d. Full opening safety valve on rig floor - Yes

e. Rotating head - Yes

f. The blooie line shall be at least 6 inches in diameter and extend at least 100 feet from the
well bore into the reserve/blooie
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g. Blooie line ignition shall be provided by a continuous pilot (ignited when drilling below
500 feet).

h. Compressor shall be tied directly to the blooieline through a manifold.

i. A mistor with a continuous stream of water shall be installed near the end of the blooie
lines for dust suppression.

6. Proposed Circulating Medium

Depth Mud Type
0 to TD Air / Mist

7. Testing, Logging, and Coring Program
a. Cores - Possible core of Ferron Sand

b. DST - None anticipated

c. Logging - DIL-GR (TD to base of surface casing).
a. FDC-CNL-GR-Cal (TD to base of surface casing).

d. Formation and Completion Interval: Ferron interval, final determination of
completion will be made by analysis of logs.
Simulation: Simulation will be designed for the particular area of interest as
encountered.

e. Frac gradient: Approximately 0.80 psi/ft.

8. Anticipated Cementing Program:

a. See Form #3, Section 24.

Final cement volumes to be calculated from caliper log with an attempt to be made to circulate cement to
the surface. A bond log will be run across the zone of interest and across zones as required by the
authorized officer to insure protection of natural resources.

9. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential Hazards:

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No H2S has been encountered in or known to
exist from previous wells drilled to similar depths in the general area. Maximum anticipated bottom hole
pressure equals approximately 1500 psi (calculated 0.517 psi/ft) and maximum anticipated surface
pressure equals approximately 862 psi (bottom hole pressure minus the pressure of a partially evacuated
hole calculated at 0.22
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Surface Use Plan
Mid-Power Resource Corporation

Ridge Runner 8-19

1. Existing Road:

a. Topo Map 'A' is the vicinity map showing the access route fromScofield, Utah.
b. Topo Map 'B' shows the proposed access road to each well. It also shows existing roads

in the immediate area.
c. The existing and proposed access road, unless otherwise stated, shall be crowned,

ditched, and dipped from the nearest improved road.
d. Occasional maintenance blading and storm repairs will keep roads in good condition.
e. There shall be no mud blading on the access road. Vehicles may be towed through the

mud provided they stay on the roadway.

2. Planned Access Roads:

a. Maximum grade will be 8°/oor less.
b. No turnouts are required.
c. Low water crossings to be placed in the proposed access road during drilling process and

culverts may be installed at a later date.
d. Road surface material will be that native to the area.
e. No cattleguards are required.
f. The proposed access road was flagged at the time the location was staked.
g. The back slopes of the proposed access road will be no steeper than vertical or ¥:1 in

rock and 2:1elsewhere.

3. Location of Existing Wells:

a. See Topo Map 'B'

4. Location of Existing and/or Proposed Facilities:

a. All Petroleum Production Facilities are to be contained within the proposed location
sites.

b. In the event that production of these wells is established, the followingwill be shown:
i. Proposed location and attendant lines, by flagging, if off well pad.

ii. Dimensions of facilities.
iii. Construction methods and materials.

c. The area used to contain the proposed production facilities will be built using native
materials. If these materials are not acceptable, then other arrangements will be made to
acquire them from private sources. These facilities will be constructed using bulldozers,
graders, and workman crews to construct and place the proposed faculties.

d. All permanent facilities placed on the locations shall be painted a non-reflective color,
which will blend with the natural environment.

e. A dike shall be constructed around the tank battery, of sufficient capacity to adequately
contain at least 110percent of the storage capacity of the largest tank within the dike.

f. All buried pipelines shall be covered to a depth of 3 feet except at road crossings where
they shall be covered to a depth of 4
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g. Construction width of the right-of-way/pipeline route shall be restricted to 50 feet of
disturbance.

h. Pipeline location warning signs shall be installed within 90 days upon completion of
construction.

5. Location and Water Supply:

a. Any water to be used for the drilling of this well will be from the Price River Water
Improvement District (an adjudicated industrial water source) and transported by a
local trucking company (Nielson Construction).

b. No water wells are to be drilled.

6. Source of Construction Materials:

a. No construction materials are needed fordrilling operations. In the event of production,
the small amount of gravel needed for facilities will be hauled in by truck form a local
gravel pit over existing access roads from the area. No special access other than for
drilling operations and pipeline construction is needed.

b. All access roads crossing BLMland is shown on Topo Map 'B'.
c. All well pad surface disturbance areas are on fee lands.

7. Methods for Handling Waste Disposal:

a. Drill cuttings will be buried in the reserve pit when covered.
b. Drilling fluids will be contained in the reserve pit.
c. Any hydrocarbon liquids produced while production testing will be contained in a test

tank. Any unavoidable spills of oil or other adverse substances or materials will be
removed immediately during drilling progress or during completion operations.

d. Portable chemical toilets will be provided and services by a local commercial sanitary
service.

e. Garbage and trash will be collected in a trash cage and its contents hauled to a sanitary
landfill. All wastes caused by the construction activities shall be promptly removed and
disposed of in a sanitary landfill or as directed by the company representative.

f. Prior to commencement of drilling, the reserve pit will be fenced on three sides using 39-
inch net wire with at least one (1) strand of barbed wire. All wire is to be stretched
before attaching to corner posts. When drilling activities are completed it will be fenced
on the fourth side and allowed to dry (if liquids are present). After drying, the fences
will be removed and the pits shall be buried. Reclamation will be undertaken no later
than the fall of the year after all drilling activity has ceased.

8. Ancillary Facilities:

a. No airstrips, camps, or other living facilities will be built off the locations. Housing and
office trailers will be on the location as seen on the location layout.

9. Well Site Layout:

a. See attached cut sheet.
b. Company representatives will determine if the pit is to be lined, and if so, the type of

material to be
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landfill. All wastes caused by the construction activities shall be promptly removed and
disposed of in a sanitary landfill or as directed by the company representative.

f. Prior to commencement of drilling, the reserve pit will be fenced on three sides using 39-
inch net wire with at least one (1) strand of barbed wire. All wire is to be stretched
before attaching to corner posts. When drilling activities are completed it will be fenced
on the fourth side and allowed to dry (if liquids are present). After drying, the fences
will be removed and the pits shall be buried. Reclamation will be undertaken no later
than the fall of the year after all drilling activity has ceased.

8. Ancillary Facilities:

a. No airstrips, camps, or other living facilities will be built off the locations. Housing and
office trailers will be on the location as seen on the location layout.

9. Well Site Layout:

a. See attached cut sheet.
b. Company representatives will determine if the pit is to be lined, and if so, the type of

material to be
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c. Topsoil shall be stripped to a depth of 4 to 6 inches and stockpiled as shown on the
location layout plat.

d. The back slopes of the locations will be no steeper than vertical or ¥:1 in rock and 2:1
elsewhere.

e. The upper edges of all cut banks on the access roads and well pads will be rounded.
f. Catchment ponds to be placed as required to intercept drainage re-routes.

10. Plans for Restoration:

a. Immediately upon completion, the location and surrounding area will be cleared of all
debris, materials, trash and junk not required for production.

b. Before any dirt work to restore the location takes place, the reserve pit must be
completely dry. The reserve pit will be reclaimed within one (1) year from the date of
well completion.

c. All disturbed areas will be seeded with the mixture, which is found suitable by the Utah
Division of Wildlife Resources and the landowner.

d. The seedbed will be prepared by disking, following the natural contour. Drill seed on
contour at a depth no greater than ¥ inch. In areas that cannot be drilled, the seed will
be broadcast at double the seeding rate and harrowed into soils. Certified seed is
recommended.

e. Fall seeding will be completed after September, and prior to prolonged ground frost.
f. If the well is a producer, access roads will be upgraded and maintained as necessary to

prevent soil erosion, and accommodate year round traffic. Areas unnecessary to
operations will be reshaped, topsoil distributed, and seed distributed according to the
above mixtures. Perennial vegetation would be established. Additional work may be
required in case of seeding failures, etc.

g. If the well is abandoned or is a dry hole, the access road and location will be restored to
approximate the original contours. During reclamation of the site, the fill material will
be pushed into cuts and up over the back slope. No depressionswill be left that would
trap water or form ponds. Topsoil will be distributed evenly over the location and
seeded according to the above mixture. The access road and the location shall be ripped
or disked prior to seeding. Perennial vegetation must be established. Additional work
shall be required in case of seeding failures, etc.

h. Annual or noxious weeds shall be controlled on all disturbed areas. Method of control
shall be by an approved mechanical method or an Environmental Protection Agency
(EPA) registered herbicide. All herbicide application will be in cooperation with Carbon
County Weed Control personnel.

11. Other Information:

a. Man uses the area for the primary purpose of grazing domestic livestock.
i. All activity shall cease when soils or road surfaces become saturated to a depth

of three inches, unless otherwise approved by the company representative.
ii. If any fossils are discovered during construction, the operator shall cease

construction immediately and notify the company representative so as to
determine the significance of the discovery.

b. A Class III cultural resource inventory was completed prior to disturbance by a qualified
professional archaeologist.

c. The operator is responsible for informing all persons in the area who are associated with
this project that they will be subject to prosecution for knowingly disturbing historic or
archaeological sites, or for collecting artifacts. If historic or archaeological materials
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uncovered during construction, the operator is to immediately stop work that might
further disturb such materials and contact the State Historic Preservation Office
(SHPO). The SHPO Officer will outline (if any) what mitigation is appropriate.

i. If the operator wished, at any time, to relocate activities to avoid the expense of
mitigation and/or delays associate with this process, the SHPO will assume
responsibility for whatever recordation and stabilization of the exposed
materials may be required. Otherwise, the operator will be responsible for
mitigation costs. The SHPO will provide technical and procedural guidelines for
the conduct of mitigation. Upon verification from the State that the required
mitigation has been completed, the operator will be allowed to resume
construction.

d. Less than 10,000 pounds of any chemical(s) from the EPA's Consolidated list of
Chemicals Subject to Reporting Under Title III of the Superfund Amendments and
Reauthorization Act (SARA) of 1986, and less then threshold planning quantity (TPQ)of
any extremely hazardous substance(s), as defined in 40 CFR, would be used, produced,
transported, stored, disposed, or associated with the proposed action.

12. Lessee's or Operator's Representative:

Marion Energy, Inc.
Mr. Keri Clarke

119South Tennessee, Suite 200
McKinney, TX 75069

(972)540-2967

13. Certification:

I hereby certify that I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the proposed drill
site(s) and access route(s); that I am familiar with the conditions which presently exist; that the
statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and correct; and, that the
work associated with the operations proposed herein will be performed by Marion Energy, Inc.
and its contractors and subcontractors in conformity with the plan and the terms and conditions
under which it is approved.

This stateme U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement

Keri Clarke Date
Company
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 49
DEPARTMEMTOF NATURAL RESOURCES

BondNo. 9570030406 DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS ANDMINING

COLLATERAL BOND

KNOW ALL MEN BY WESE PRESEMTS:

Thatwe (operator name) Mid-Power Resource Corporation as Principal,
which is duly authorized and quatined to do business in the State of Utah, em held and timilybound unto the State of Utah in the sum of

One Hundred Eighty Four Thousand One Hundred EightŸ dollars ($ $184,180.00 )
lawful moneyof the Unded States by pittue of the ioNowingfinancial instruments (cash account, negodablebands of the United States, a state
or municipality, or negotiable certificate of deposit- aoe RuleR649-3-1):

Negotiable Certificate of Deposit #9578030406

payable lo the Directorof the Divisionof Cit, Gas and Mining,as agentof the State of Utah, for the use and benofit of the State of Utah for the
faithful payment ofwhich we bind ourselves, our heks, executors,administrators and successors, jointlyand severallyby these presents.

THE CONDiT10N OF THIS 061JGA110N JS SUCH TNAT, WHEREAS the Principal Is or wil be engaged in the ddiffng,redifling, deepening,
repairing, operating, and plugging and abandonment of a weil or wells and metodng thewell eita er sites In the State of Utah for the purposes of
oil or gas production andfor the infection and disposal of tiukisin connection therewith for the following described land or well:

Blanket Bond To cover all wens thiMed in the State of Uta

Individual Bond: Weil No•

Sectiort Township: Range:
County•

, utah

NOW, THEREFORE, fftheabove bounden Pdacipal shaficomply with all thepovisions of the laws of the State of Utah and the rules, orders and
raquirements ofthe Board of Oll. Gas and Miningof the State of Utah. Including,but not limited te thepmper plugging and abandonment of wells
and well site restoration, then thisobigation is void; otherwise, the same sbal be and remain in fullforce and effect,

IN TEST1MONYlNHEREOF, said Principal has hereuntosubscribed its name and has caused thisInstrument to be signed by Its duly authodzed
allicers and Its corporate or notary seal to be afixed this

dayof March
, 20 05

(Corporate or Notary Seal here)

See attached Jurat

Attestee: Date
,

Mid-Power Resource Corporation
Principal (company name)

James W. Scott CEO &President
N Title

Signature

(Er2œz)

CO
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lawful moneyof the Unded States by pittue of the ioNowingfinancial instruments (cash account, negodablebands of the United States, a state
or municipality, or negotiable certificate of deposit- aoe RuleR649-3-1):

Negotiable Certificate of Deposit #9578030406

payable lo the Directorof the Divisionof Cit, Gas and Mining,as agentof the State of Utah, for the use and benofit of the State of Utah for the
faithful payment ofwhich we bind ourselves, our heks, executors,administrators and successors, jointlyand severallyby these presents.

THE CONDiT10N OF THIS 061JGA110N JS SUCH TNAT, WHEREAS the Principal Is or wil be engaged in the ddiffng,redifling, deepening,
repairing, operating, and plugging and abandonment of a weil or wells and metodng thewell eita er sites In the State of Utah for the purposes of
oil or gas production andfor the infection and disposal of tiukisin connection therewith for the following described land or well:

Blanket Bond To cover all wens thiMed in the State of Uta

Individual Bond: Weil No•

Sectiort Township: Range:

County•
, utah

NOW, THEREFORE, fftheabove bounden Pdacipal shaficomply with all thepovisions of the laws of the State of Utah and the rules, orders and
raquirements ofthe Board of Oll. Gas and Miningof the State of Utah. Including,but not limited te thepmper plugging and abandonment of wells
and well site restoration, then thisobigation is void; otherwise, the same sbal be and remain in fullforce and effect,

IN TEST1MONYlNHEREOF, said Principal has hereuntosubscribed its name and has caused thisInstrument to be signed by Its duly authodzed
allicers and Its corporate or notary seal to be afixed this

dayof March
, 20 05

(Corporate or Notary Seal here)

See attached Jurat

Attestee: Date
,

Mid-Power Resource Corporation

Principal (company name)
James W. Scott CEO &President

N Title

Signature

(Er2œz)

CO
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ALL-PURPOSE ACKNOWLEDGMENT

State of Califomia

Coun of
ss.

On erh 005 before me,

personally appeared 4 Û.
personally known to me - OR - prove me on the basis of satisfactory

evidence to be the person(s) whose name(s)
isfare subscribed to the within instrument and
acknowledged to me that he/shelthey executed
the same in his/her/their authorized

AYANAHEPBtJRN capacity(ies), and that by his/her/their
. ora signatures(s) on the instrument the person(s),

or the entity upon behalf of which the
person(s) acted, executed the instrument.

WITNESS my hand and official seaL

NOTARY'S 510NATURE

OPTIONAL INFORMATION
The information below is not required by law. However, it could prevent fraudulent attachment of Ihis acknowl-
edgment to an unauthorized document.

CAPACITYCLAIMEDBYSIGNER(PRINCIPAL) DESCRIPTION OF ATTACHEDDOCUMENT
ODR3DRUAE

OFFICER

TITLE OR TYPE OF DOCUMRNT
TOIÆœ

O PARTNER(S)
ATTORNEY-IN-FAcr NUMBER OF PAGES

TRUSTEE(S)

O GUARDIAN/CONSERVATOR
DATEOF DOCUMENT

O OTHER:

JI'HER

SIGNER IS REPRESENTING: RIGHTTHUMBPRINT È
NAMEOF PERSON(S)OR FNTITY(IES)

OF
- - SIGNER

APA 5/99 VALLEY-SIERRA. 800-362

ALL-PURPOSE ACKNOWLEDGMENT

State of Califomia

Coun of
ss.

On erh 005 before me,

personally appeared 4 Û.
personally known to me - OR - prove me on the basis of satisfactory

evidence to be the person(s) whose name(s)
isfare subscribed to the within instrument and
acknowledged to me that he/shelthey executed
the same in his/her/their authorized

AYANAHEPBtJRN capacity(ies), and that by his/her/their
. ora signatures(s) on the instrument the person(s),

or the entity upon behalf of which the
person(s) acted, executed the instrument.

WITNESS my hand and official seaL

NOTARY'S 510NATURE

OPTIONAL INFORMATION
The information below is not required by law. However, it could prevent fraudulent attachment of Ihis acknowl-
edgment to an unauthorized document.

CAPACITYCLAIMEDBYSIGNER(PRINCIPAL) DESCRIPTION OF ATTACHEDDOCUMENT
ODR3DRUAE

OFFICER

TITLE OR TYPE OF DOCUMRNT
TOIÆœ

O PARTNER(S)
ATTORNEY-IN-FAcr NUMBER OF PAGES

TRUSTEE(S)

O GUARDIAN/CONSERVATOR
DATEOF DOCUMENT

O OTHER:

JI'HER

SIGNER IS REPRESENTING: RIGHTTHUMBPRINT È
NAMEOF PERSON(S)OR FNTITY(IES)

OF
- - SIGNER

APA 5/99 VALLEY-SIERRA. 800-362

ALL-PURPOSE ACKNOWLEDGMENT

State of Califomia

Coun of
ss.

On erh 005 before me,

personally appeared 4 Û.
personally known to me - OR - prove me on the basis of satisfactory

evidence to be the person(s) whose name(s)
isfare subscribed to the within instrument and
acknowledged to me that he/shelthey executed
the same in his/her/their authorized

AYANAHEPBtJRN capacity(ies), and that by his/her/their
. ora signatures(s) on the instrument the person(s),

or the entity upon behalf of which the
person(s) acted, executed the instrument.

WITNESS my hand and official seaL

NOTARY'S 510NATURE

OPTIONAL INFORMATION
The information below is not required by law. However, it could prevent fraudulent attachment of Ihis acknowl-
edgment to an unauthorized document.

CAPACITYCLAIMEDBYSIGNER(PRINCIPAL) DESCRIPTION OF ATTACHEDDOCUMENT
ODR3DRUAE

OFFICER

TITLE OR TYPE OF DOCUMRNT
TOIÆœ

O PARTNER(S)
ATTORNEY-IN-FAcr NUMBER OF PAGES

TRUSTEE(S)

O GUARDIAN/CONSERVATOR
DATEOF DOCUMENT

O OTHER:

JI'HER

SIGNER IS REPRESENTING: RIGHTTHUMBPRINT È
NAMEOF PERSON(S)OR FNTITY(IES)

OF
- - SIGNER

APA 5/99 VALLEY-SIERRA. 800-362



August 24, 2004

Mr. Ed Bonner
State of Utah
School and Institutional Trust

Lands Administration
675 East 500 South, Suite 500
Salt Lake City, Utah 84102-2818

Re: Mid-Power Resource Corporation
Bonding Requirement Changes

Dear Ed:

In response to TLA's bonding requirement changes, we have reviewed and verified that
our bonding requirements are in compliance with the new rules.

Our findings indicate that a cash deposit in the amount of $20,000 was accepted by TLA
on September 11, 2002 as surety to cover operations of the Utah Mineral State Well and
the Oman 2-20 Well under lease ML1256. Those two wells are also covered under our
bond with DOGMíor plugging and abandonment.

Since the new rules require operators to post a pedormance bond with TLA in the
amount of $5,000 per well, we request that the cash balance of $10,000 be release back
to Mid-Power Resource Corporation.

Please feel free to contact me should you have any questions conceming this matter. I
can be reached at 702-838-0716.

Sincerely,

Susan Trimboli

CC: Earlene Russell - DOGM -- Fax Number 801-359-3940
Mark Roedell -Mid-Power Service
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-witMbe-eppropriate-we!! or-statewide.teplacementJion I_future_lpang geesin jhe
appropriate amount, your current bond will be released. If you would like your bond with TLA lo
be transferred to DOGM's ownership, and if the instrument allows for such a transfer, please
make arrangements with your surety and with DOGM. No bonds willbe released by TLA until
sufficient evidence is provided that all required bonding is in place and that there are no
outstanding obligations to TLA.

There will be a transitionperiod, but TLA sees this as a positive move for the industry that will
simplify your statewide bonding requirements in the State of Utah.

We appreciate your assistance with these changes and look forward to hearing from you.

Yours very truly,

SCHO AND INSTITUTIONALTRUST
LAN STRA

LaVonne J. arrison
Assistant D rector/Oil &
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WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 04/18/2006 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-015-30682

WELL NAME: RIDGE RUNNER 8-19

OPERATOR: MID-POWER RESOURCE CORP ( N2215 ) PHONE NUMBER: 702-838-0716

CONTACT: KERI CLARKE

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
NESW 20 140S 070E .Tech Review Initials Date
SURFACE: 1513 FSL 1735 FWL

BOTTOM: 2211 FNL 0747 FEL Jag og Engineering

COUNTY: EMERY Geology
LATITUDE: 39.59027 LONGITUDE: -111.1667

UTM SURF EASTINGS:485689 NORTHINGS: 4382087 Surface

FIELD NAME: CLEAR CREEK ( 10 )

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal

LEASE NUMBER: U-01740 PROPOSED FORMATION: FRSD

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal COALBED METHANE WELL? NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

l' Plat R649-2-3.

/' Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[] Unit: CLEAR CREEK
(No. 9578030406 )

Potash (Y/N)
R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

' Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception

(No.PRRV )
Drilling Unit

RDCC Review (Y/N)
Board Cause No:

(Date: ) Eff Date:
Aid Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

Lie Intent to Commingle (Y/N) .R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:
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Diana Whitney - Clear Creek.doc Page 1

United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O.Box45155

SaltLakeCity,Utah 84145-0155

INREPLYREFERTO:
3160
(UT-922)

April25,2006

Adeniorandurn

To: Assistant Field Office Manager Resources,
Moab Field Office

From: Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer

Subject: 2006 Plan of Development Clear Creek Unit Carbon County,
Utah.

Pursuant to email between Diana Whitney, Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, and Mickey
Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land Management, the following wells are
planned for calendar year 2006 within the Clear Unit, Carbon County, Utah.

API# WELLNAME LOCATION
(Proposed PZ Ferron)

43-015-30683 Ridge Runner 2-18 Sec 17 T14S RO7E 0338 FSL 0279 FWL
BHL Sec 18 T14S RO7E 0476 FNL 1524 FEL

43-015-30684 Ridge Runner 11-18 Sec 17 T14S RO7E 0292 FSL 0259 FWL
BHL Sec 18 T14S RO7E 0270 FSL 2471 FEL

43-015-30685 Ridge Runner 11-17 Sec 17 T14S RO7E 0315 FSL 0269 FWL
BHL Sec 17 T14S RO7E 2439 FSL 2470 FWL

43-015-30680 Ridge Runner 1-30 Sec 20 T14S R07E 1502 FSL 1719 FWL
BHL Sec 30 T14S RO7E 0707 FNL 0246 FEL

43-015-30681 Ridge Runner 7-20 Sec 20 T14S RO7E 1524 FSL 1752 FWL
BHL Sec 20 T145 RO7E 1434 FNL 1454 FEL

43-015-30682 Ridge Runner 8-19 Sec 20 T14S RO7E 1513 FSL 1735 FWL
BHL Sec 19 T145 RO7E 2211 FNL 0747 FEL

This office has no objection to permitting the wells at this
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JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
Governor

GARY R. HERBERT
,, Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah
April 26, 2006

Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAEL R. STYLER
Executive Director

Mid-Power Resource Corporation
Division of 8290 West Sahara, #186

Oil, Gas & Mining Las Vegas, NV 89117
JOHN R. BAZA
Division Director

Re: Ridge Runner 8-19 Well, Surface Location 1514' FSL, 1736' FWL, NE SW,
Sec. 20, T. 14 South, R. 7 East, Bottom Location 2211' FNL, 0747' FEL,
SE NE, Sec. 19, T. 14 South, R. 7 East, Emery County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-015-30682.

Sincerely,

Gil Hunt
Associate Director

mf
Enclosures

cc: Emery County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Moab District Office

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 •
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Operator: Mid-Power Resource Corporation
Well Name & Number Ridge Runner 8-19

API Number: 43-015-30682
Lease: USA-U-01740

Surface Location: NE SW Sec. 20 T. 14 South R. 7 East
Bottom Location: SE NE Sec. 19 T. 14 South R. 7 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Board").
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.

6. In accordance with Utah Admin. R.649-3-11, Directional Drilling, the operator shall submit a
complete angular deviation and directional survey report to the Division within 30 days
following completion of the
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following completion of the
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May 5, 2006 , Û

Utah Division of Oil Gas and Mining
ATTN: Diana Whitney
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah
84116

RE: Ridge Runner #11-18, #2-18, #11-17, #8-19, #1-30, #7-20
Mid-Power Resource Corp. Amendment to Surface use and Drilling Plans
Clear Creek Unit 13S-7E and 14S-7E, Carbon and Emery Counties, Utah

Dear Ms. Whitney

Per Tom Lloyd's (USDA Forest Service) request, please find enclosed copies of
the amended Surface Use Plans and Drilling Plans that pertain to the above
referenced wells that are to be drilled in the Clear Creek Unit located in 13S-7E

and 14S-7E, Carbon and Emery Counties, Utah.. I have also included a diagram
that depicts the well equipment layout of each pad site.

If you require any further information, please do not hesitate to contact me at
(972) 540-2967 ext. 3004 or email bevans@marionenergy.com

Sincerely,

Benjamin Evans
Landman
Marion Energy Inc.
(Agent for Mid-Power Resource Corp.)

RECE!VED

DN.0F OlL,GAS&MINlNG

8290 West Sahara Avenue, Suite 186, Las Vegas, Nevada, 89117
Telephone: (702) 838-0716, Fax: (702)

WER
RESOURCE CORPORATION

May 5, 2006 , Û

Utah Division of Oil Gas and Mining
ATTN: Diana Whitney
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah
84116

RE: Ridge Runner #11-18, #2-18, #11-17, #8-19, #1-30, #7-20
Mid-Power Resource Corp. Amendment to Surface use and Drilling Plans
Clear Creek Unit 13S-7E and 14S-7E, Carbon and Emery Counties, Utah

Dear Ms. Whitney

Per Tom Lloyd's (USDA Forest Service) request, please find enclosed copies of
the amended Surface Use Plans and Drilling Plans that pertain to the above
referenced wells that are to be drilled in the Clear Creek Unit located in 13S-7E

and 14S-7E, Carbon and Emery Counties, Utah.. I have also included a diagram
that depicts the well equipment layout of each pad site.

If you require any further information, please do not hesitate to contact me at
(972) 540-2967 ext. 3004 or email bevans@marionenergy.com

Sincerely,

Benjamin Evans
Landman
Marion Energy Inc.
(Agent for Mid-Power Resource Corp.)

RECE!VED

DN.0F OlL,GAS&MINlNG

8290 West Sahara Avenue, Suite 186, Las Vegas, Nevada, 89117
Telephone: (702) 838-0716, Fax: (702)

WER
RESOURCE CORPORATION

May 5, 2006 , Û

Utah Division of Oil Gas and Mining
ATTN: Diana Whitney
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah
84116

RE: Ridge Runner #11-18, #2-18, #11-17, #8-19, #1-30, #7-20
Mid-Power Resource Corp. Amendment to Surface use and Drilling Plans
Clear Creek Unit 13S-7E and 14S-7E, Carbon and Emery Counties, Utah

Dear Ms. Whitney

Per Tom Lloyd's (USDA Forest Service) request, please find enclosed copies of
the amended Surface Use Plans and Drilling Plans that pertain to the above
referenced wells that are to be drilled in the Clear Creek Unit located in 13S-7E

and 14S-7E, Carbon and Emery Counties, Utah.. I have also included a diagram
that depicts the well equipment layout of each pad site.

If you require any further information, please do not hesitate to contact me at
(972) 540-2967 ext. 3004 or email bevans@marionenergy.com

Sincerely,

Benjamin Evans
Landman
Marion Energy Inc.
(Agent for Mid-Power Resource Corp.)

RECE!VED

DN.0F OlL,GAS&MINlNG

8290 West Sahara Avenue, Suite 186, Las Vegas, Nevada, 89117
Telephone: (702) 838-0716, Fax: (702)



EXISTING
ACCESS RO 30'

EXISTING
CUT

PIT SECTION
EXISTING
TOPSOIL APPROXIMATECUT
STOCKPILE = 1965 CU YDS.

Storage
Tank

EXISTING
FILL

Toilet EXISTING

TALON RESOURCES, INC.
19519erth100WestP.O.Box1230

Iludagtee, Utah 84528
Phone(435)í87-5310Fu (435)687-5311

EXISTING

EXISTING CUT
LOCATIONLAYOUT

FLARE PIT ON EXISTINGWELL PAD
Section 20, T14S, R7E, S.L.B.&M.

RIDGE RUNNER # 8-19
Orown By· Checked By

N. BUTKOVICH L.W.J.
Drowing No, Date:

4/12 06A--4
1" = 50'

Job No.
Sheet Ê of 4 2395

EXISTING
ACCESS RO 30'

EXISTING
CUT

PIT SECTION
EXISTING
TOPSOIL APPROXIMATECUT
STOCKPILE = 1965 CU YDS.

Storage
Tank

EXISTING
FILL

Toilet EXISTING

TALON RESOURCES, INC.
19519erth100WestP.O.Box1230

Iludagtee, Utah 84528
Phone(435)í87-5310Fu (435)687-5311

EXISTING

EXISTING CUT
LOCATIONLAYOUT

FLARE PIT ON EXISTINGWELL PAD
Section 20, T14S, R7E, S.L.B.&M.

RIDGE RUNNER # 8-19
Orown By· Checked By

N. BUTKOVICH L.W.J.
Drowing No, Date:

4/12 06A--4
1" = 50'

Job No.
Sheet Ê of 4 2395

EXISTING
ACCESS RO 30'

EXISTING
CUT

PIT SECTION
EXISTING
TOPSOIL APPROXIMATECUT
STOCKPILE = 1965 CU YDS.

Storage
Tank

EXISTING
FILL

Toilet EXISTING

TALON RESOURCES, INC.
19519erth100WestP.O.Box1230

Iludagtee, Utah 84528
Phone(435)í87-5310Fu (435)687-5311

EXISTING

EXISTING CUT
LOCATIONLAYOUT

FLARE PIT ON EXISTINGWELL PAD
Section 20, T14S, R7E, S.L.B.&M.

RIDGE RUNNER # 8-19
Orown By· Checked By

N. BUTKOVICH L.W.J.
Drowing No, Date:

4/12 06A--4
1" = 50'

Job No.
Sheet Ê of 4 2395



Surface Use Plan
Mid-Power Resource Corporation

Ridge Runner #8-19

Thirteen Point Surface Use Plan

1. Existing Roads

a. The proposed well site is located approximately 15 miles south of Scofield,
Utah.

b. Directions to the location from Scofield, Utah are as follows:

From Scofield proceed south on Highway 96 for approximately 2.8 miles.
Turn west onto the Eccles Canyon Road (Highway 264) and proceed 4.1
miles. Turn left onto the Forest Service Road (#018)and proceed through a
gate and then in a southeasterly direction for approximately 8 miles. Turn
right onto the new access road and continue 0.1 miles to the location.

c. For location of access roads see Maps A & B.

d. Top map A is the vicinity map showing the access route from Scofield, Utah.

e. Topo map B shows the proposed access road to each well. It also shows
existing roads in the immediate area

f. Improvement to the existing Forest Service Road will require upgrading as
specified by the Forest Service.

g. All existing roads will be maintained and kept in good repair during all
drilling and completion operations associated with this well.

h. Existing roads and newly constructed roads on surface under the jurisdiction
of any Surface Managing Agency shall be maintained in accordance with the
standards of the SMA.

i. Road use permit # 0410-03-13 which expires June l'' 2006 is currently being
renewed/extended. Maintenance of the access road will be conducted
according to conditions outlines in the referenced road use
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2. Planned Access Roads

a. The last 7.1 miles of access road will be upgraded to accommodate rig traffic.
The road will have a subgrade of 14 feet with a running surface of 12 feet.
Four inches of gravel will be placed on portions of the access road.

b. Surface disturbance and vehicular travel will be limited to the approved
location and approved access route. Any additional area needed will be
approved in advance.

3. Location of Existing Wells Within a 1-Mile Radius of the Proposed Location

a. Water wells - non

b. Injection wells - none

c. Producing wells - none

d. Drilling wells - none

e. Shut-in wells - Ridge Runner #11-20 & #13-17 (See Location Map L-1)

f. For reference please see topo map B

4. Location of Tank Batteries and Production Facilities

a. All permanent structures (onsite for six months or longer) constructed or
installed (including pump jacks)will be painted a neutral color to blend with
the surrounding environment. The proposed color for this site is Juniper
Green unless otherwise stipulated by the Forest Services. Facilities required
to comply with the Occupational Safety and Health Act (OSHA) will be
excluded.

b. If storage facilities/tank batteries are constructed on this lease, the
facility/battery or the wellpad shall be surrounded by a containment dike or
sufficient capacity to contain at a minimum, the entire content of the largest
tank within the facility/battery, unless more stringent protective requirements

are deemed necessary by the authorized officer.

c. All loading lines will be placed inside the berm surrounding the tank battery

d. Gas meter runs for each well will be located within 500 feet of the wellhead.
The gas flowline will be buried or anchored down from the wellhead to the
meter and 500 feet downstream of the meter run or any production facilities.
Meter runs will be housed and/or fenced. All buried pipelines shall
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covered to a depth of 3ft except at road crossings where they shall be covered
to a depth of 4ft.

e. The oil and gas measurement facilities will be installed on the well location.
The oil and gas meters will be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries.
Tests for meter accuracy will be conducted monthly for the first three months
on new meter installations and at least quarterly thereafter. The AO will be
provided with a date and time for the initial meter calibration and all future
meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will be
submitted to the Vernal District Office. All meter measurement facilities will
conform with Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 4 for liquid hydrocarbons and
Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 5 for natural gas measurement.

f. A production facility diagram is attached showing placement of all proposed
production facilities. (See survey outline A-3)

g. Any necessary pits will be properly fenced to prevent any wildlife entry.

h. All site security guidelines identified in 43 CFR 3162.7 regulations will be
adhered to.

i. All access roads will be maintained as necessary to prevent erosion and
accommodate year-round traffic.

j. The road will be maintained in a safe useable condition.

k. The site will require periodic maintenance to ensure that drainages are kept
open and free of debris, ice, and snow, and that surfaces are properly treated
to reduce erosion, fugitive dust, and impacts to adjacent areas.

l. The area used to contain the proposed production facilities will be built using
native materials. If these materials are not acceptable, then other
arrangements will be made to acquire them from private sources. These
facilities will be constructed using bulldozers, graders, and workman crews to
construct and place the proposed facilities.

5. Location and Water Supply

a. Any water to be used for the drilling of this well will be from the Price River
Water Improvement District (an adjudicated industrial water source) and

transported by a local trucking company (Nielson Construction).
b. No water wells are to be drilled.

6. Source of Construction Material

a. Surface and subsoil materials in the immediate area will be
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b. No construction materials are needed for drilling operations. In the event of
production, the small amount of gravel needed for facilities will be hauled in
by truck from a local gravel pit over existing access roads in the area. No
special access other than for drilling operations and pipeline construction is
needed.

c. The use of materials under BLM jurisdictionwill conform with 43 CFR
3610.2.3. Construction material will not be located on lease.

d. No construction materials will be removed from Federal land.

e. All access roads crossing BLM land is shown on topo map B.

7. Methods of Handling Waste Disposal

a. The reserve pit will be constructed so as not to leak, break, or allow discharge.
The reserve pit will be lined with a minimum 10mil plastic liner.

b. The reserve pit will be constructed of sufficient size and capacity for the
necessary fluids for drilling and to contain any runoff from the drill site. Pits
will not be constructed within intermittent or perennial stream channels.

c. No trash, scrap pipe, etc., that could puncture the liner will be disposed of in
the pit. Garbage and trash will be collected in a trash cage and its contents
hauled to a sanitary landfill. All wastes caused by the construction activities
shall be promptly removed and disposed of in a sanitary landfill or as directed
by the company representative.

d. The reserve pit will be constructed in undisturbed material and below the
natural ground level.

e. A minimum 2-foot freeboard will be maintained in the pit at all times during
the drilling operation and the pit will be fenced during drilling and completion
operations.

f. Burning will not be allowed. All trash will be contained in a trash cage and its
contents removed at the end of drilling operations and hauled to an approved

disposal sight.

g. After first production, produced waste water will be confined to a unlined pit
or storage tank for a period not to exceed ninety (90) days. During the 90-day
period, in accordance with Onshore Order No. 7, an application for approval
of a permanent disposal method and location, along with the required water
analysis, will be submitted for the AO's approval. Failure to file
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application within the time allowed will be considered an incident of
noncompliance.

h. Drill cuttings are to be contained and buried in the reserve pit.

i. Any salts and/or chemicals which are an integral part of the drilling system

will be disposed of in the same manner as the drilling fluid.

j. Sewage will be placed in a portable chemical toilet or holding tank and
disposed of in accordance with state and county regulations.

k. The produced fluids (other than water) will be produced into a test tank until
such time as construction of production facilities is completed. Any spills of

oil, gas, salt water or other produced fluids will be cleaned up and removed.

8 .Ancillary Facilities

There are no airstrips, camps, or other facilities planned during the drilling of the
proposed well.

9. Well Site Lavout

a. All cut and fill slopes will be such that stability can be maintained for the life
of the activity. The upper edges of all cut banks on the access roads and well

pads will be rounded. Cut and fill slopes will be constructed as follows:

Height of Slope Slope
0-5 feet 3:1
6-10 feet 2:1
Over 10 feet 1-l/2:1

b. All fills will be free from vegetative materials and will be compacted in lifts
no greater than 12 inches in thickness to a minimum of 90 percent Proctor dry
density sufficient to prevent excessive settlement.

c. The working surface of the drill site will be surfaced with crushed gravel to a

depth sufficient to support anticipated loads throughout the life of the well.

Usually a depth of 12 inches of gravel is anticipated.

d. A diversion ditch having the minimum dimensions of 3 feet horizontal to 1
foot vertical (3:1 ditch), will be constructed around the site to divert surface
waters from flowing onto the site. The ditch will be located at the base of the
cut slope and around the toe of the fill slopes (see Drawing No. 1 -

Construction Requirements of Typical Well Sites). A straw dike will be
constructed in the ditch outflow to trap any sediment produced from the raw

slopes. A culvert will be necessary where the access road enters the
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such time as construction of production facilities is completed. Any spills of

oil, gas, salt water or other produced fluids will be cleaned up and removed.

8 .Ancillary Facilities

There are no airstrips, camps, or other facilities planned during the drilling of the
proposed well.

9. Well Site Lavout

a. All cut and fill slopes will be such that stability can be maintained for the life
of the activity. The upper edges of all cut banks on the access roads and well

pads will be rounded. Cut and fill slopes will be constructed as follows:

Height of Slope Slope
0-5 feet 3:1
6-10 feet 2:1
Over 10 feet 1-l/2:1

b. All fills will be free from vegetative materials and will be compacted in lifts
no greater than 12 inches in thickness to a minimum of 90 percent Proctor dry
density sufficient to prevent excessive settlement.

c. The working surface of the drill site will be surfaced with crushed gravel to a

depth sufficient to support anticipated loads throughout the life of the well.

Usually a depth of 12 inches of gravel is anticipated.

d. A diversion ditch having the minimum dimensions of 3 feet horizontal to 1
foot vertical (3:1 ditch), will be constructed around the site to divert surface
waters from flowing onto the site. The ditch will be located at the base of the
cut slope and around the toe of the fill slopes (see Drawing No. 1 -

Construction Requirements of Typical Well Sites). A straw dike will be
constructed in the ditch outflow to trap any sediment produced from the raw

slopes. A culvert will be necessary where the access road enters the
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e. A berm will be constructed around the perimeter of the site to contain all
precipitation, spills, and other fluids from leaving the site. The berm will be a

minimum of 18 inches high, 12 inches wide at the top, and having 1-l/2:1 side
slopes. The site surface will be graded to drain to the reserve pit. The
drainage pattern to be constructed will be modified for each site, depending on
the site specific conditions.

f. The reserve pit will be located on the east side of the location.

g. The stockpiled topsoil (first six inches or maximum available) will be stored
along the perimeter of the location as shown on the location platt.

h. See Location Layout for orientation of rig, cross section of drill pad and cuts
and fills. (See attached Platt A-4)

i. The location of mud tanks, reserve pit, trash cage, pipe racks, living facilities
and soil stockpiles will be shown on the Location Layout.

j. All pits will be fenced to prevent wildlife entry.

k. The reserve pit fencing will be on three sides during drilling operations and on
the fourth side when the rig moves off the location. Pits will be fenced and
maintained until cleanup. Reclamation will be undertaken no later than the
fall of the year after all drilling activity has ceased.

10. Plans for Restoration of Surface

Dry Hole

a. Rehabilitation of the entire site will be required and will commence
immediately after the drilling is complete. The site will be restored as nearly
practical to its original condition. Cut and fill slopes will be reduced and
graded to conform to the adjacent terrain.

b. Drainages will be reestablished and temporary measures will be required to
prevent erosion to the site until vegetation is established.

c. Generally speaking, the standpipe for well identifications will be removed on
National Forest lands. A final determination will be made on a case-by-case

basis.

d. After final grading and before the replacement of topsoil, the entire surface of
the site shall be scarified to eliminate slippage surfaces and to promote root

penetration. Topsoil will then be spread over the site to achieve

e. A berm will be constructed around the perimeter of the site to contain all
precipitation, spills, and other fluids from leaving the site. The berm will be a

minimum of 18 inches high, 12 inches wide at the top, and having 1-l/2:1 side
slopes. The site surface will be graded to drain to the reserve pit. The
drainage pattern to be constructed will be modified for each site, depending on
the site specific conditions.

f. The reserve pit will be located on the east side of the location.

g. The stockpiled topsoil (first six inches or maximum available) will be stored
along the perimeter of the location as shown on the location platt.

h. See Location Layout for orientation of rig, cross section of drill pad and cuts
and fills. (See attached Platt A-4)

i. The location of mud tanks, reserve pit, trash cage, pipe racks, living facilities
and soil stockpiles will be shown on the Location Layout.

j. All pits will be fenced to prevent wildlife entry.

k. The reserve pit fencing will be on three sides during drilling operations and on
the fourth side when the rig moves off the location. Pits will be fenced and
maintained until cleanup. Reclamation will be undertaken no later than the
fall of the year after all drilling activity has ceased.

10. Plans for Restoration of Surface

Dry Hole

a. Rehabilitation of the entire site will be required and will commence
immediately after the drilling is complete. The site will be restored as nearly
practical to its original condition. Cut and fill slopes will be reduced and
graded to conform to the adjacent terrain.

b. Drainages will be reestablished and temporary measures will be required to
prevent erosion to the site until vegetation is established.

c. Generally speaking, the standpipe for well identifications will be removed on
National Forest lands. A final determination will be made on a case-by-case

basis.

d. After final grading and before the replacement of topsoil, the entire surface of
the site shall be scarified to eliminate slippage surfaces and to promote root

penetration. Topsoil will then be spread over the site to achieve

e. A berm will be constructed around the perimeter of the site to contain all
precipitation, spills, and other fluids from leaving the site. The berm will be a

minimum of 18 inches high, 12 inches wide at the top, and having 1-l/2:1 side
slopes. The site surface will be graded to drain to the reserve pit. The
drainage pattern to be constructed will be modified for each site, depending on
the site specific conditions.

f. The reserve pit will be located on the east side of the location.

g. The stockpiled topsoil (first six inches or maximum available) will be stored
along the perimeter of the location as shown on the location platt.

h. See Location Layout for orientation of rig, cross section of drill pad and cuts
and fills. (See attached Platt A-4)

i. The location of mud tanks, reserve pit, trash cage, pipe racks, living facilities
and soil stockpiles will be shown on the Location Layout.

j. All pits will be fenced to prevent wildlife entry.

k. The reserve pit fencing will be on three sides during drilling operations and on
the fourth side when the rig moves off the location. Pits will be fenced and
maintained until cleanup. Reclamation will be undertaken no later than the
fall of the year after all drilling activity has ceased.

10. Plans for Restoration of Surface

Dry Hole

a. Rehabilitation of the entire site will be required and will commence
immediately after the drilling is complete. The site will be restored as nearly
practical to its original condition. Cut and fill slopes will be reduced and
graded to conform to the adjacent terrain.

b. Drainages will be reestablished and temporary measures will be required to
prevent erosion to the site until vegetation is established.

c. Generally speaking, the standpipe for well identifications will be removed on
National Forest lands. A final determination will be made on a case-by-case

basis.

d. After final grading and before the replacement of topsoil, the entire surface of
the site shall be scarified to eliminate slippage surfaces and to promote root

penetration. Topsoil will then be spread over the site to achieve



approximate uniform, stable thickness consistent with the established
contours.

e. A temporary fence will be constructed around the site until vegetation is
established. The fence will then be removed.

f. At such time as the well is plugged and abandoned, the operator shall submit a

subsequent report of abandonment.

Producing Location

a. Site reclamation for producing wells will be accomplished for portions of the
site not required for the continued operation of the well. All disturbed surface
will be treated to prevent erosion and to complement the esthetics of the area.

A new site plan will be required encompassing the facilities required for
operation and interim reclamation measures.

b. Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area will be
cleared of all unused tubing, equipment, debris, materials, trash and junknot
required for production.

c. Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons on the pit shall be
removed in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-1.

d. The plastic nylon reinforced liner shall be torn and perforated before
backfilling of the reserve pit.

e. At the end of drilling operations, drilling fluids will be hauled to an approve

disposal site. All polluting substances or contaminated materials, such as oil,
oil-saturated soil, and gravel, will be buried within a minimum of 2 feet of
clean soil as cover or be removed from the Forest.

f. Once the reserve pit is dry, the reserve pit and that portion of the location not
needed for production facilities/operations will be recontoured to the
approximate natural contours.

g. The cut and fill slopes and all other disturbed areas not needed for the
production operation will be topsoiled and re-vegetated. The berm will be
removed and the site graded to drain.

h. The site will be seeded and/or planted as prescribed by the Forest Service.
This prescription will be determined prior to site construction on a site
specific basis. Nutrients and soil amendments will be applied to the
redistributed surface soil later as necessary to meet the re-vegetation
requirements. Fall seeding will be completed after September, and prior to
prolonged ground
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i. Annual or noxious weeds shall be controlled on all disturbed areas. Method
of control shall be by approved mechanical method or an Environmental
Protection Agency (EPA) registered herbicide. All herbicide application will

be in cooperation with Forest Service personel.

11. Surface Ownership

Access Roads - All roads are located within the Manti-La Sal National Forest.
Portions of the access road are located on private lands.

Well Pad - The well pad is located on lands managed by the Manti-La Sal
National Forest.

12. Other Information

a. A Class III cultural resource inventory will be completed prior to
disturbance by a qualified professiorial archaeologist.

b. The operator is responsible for informing all persons in the area who are
associated with this project that they will be subject to prosecution for
knowingly disturbing historic or archaeological sites, or for collecting
artifacts. If historic or archaeological materials are uncovered during
construction, the operator is to immediately stop work that might further
disturb such materials, and contact the authorized officer (AO). Within
five working days the AO will inform the operator to:

i. whether the materials appear eligible for the National Register of

Historic Places;

ii. the mitigation measures the operator will likely have to undertake

before the site can be used (assuming the site preservation is not
necessary); and

iii. a time frame for the AO to complete and expedited review under

36 CFR 800.11 to confirm, through the State Historic Preservation
Officer, that the findings of the AO are correct and that mitigation
is appropriate. If the operator wishes, at any time, to relocate

activities to avoid the expense of mitigation and/or the delays
associated with this process, the AO will assume responsibility for
whatever recordation and stabilization of the exposed materials
may be required. Otherwise, the operator will be responsible for
mitigation costs. The AO will provide technical and procedural
guidelines for the conduct of mitigation. Upon verification from
the AO that required mitigation has been completed, the operator
will then be allowed to resume
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c. Less than 10,000 pounds of any chemical(s) from the EPA's Consolidated
list of Chemicals Subject to Reporting Under Title III of the Superfund
Amendments and Reauthorization Act (SARA) Of 1986, as defined in 40
CFR, would be used, produces, transported, stored, disposed, or associated
with the proposed action.

d. All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that
full compliance is made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil
and Gas Orders, the approved plan of operations, and any applicable
Notice to Lessees. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his
subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished the field
representative to insure compliance.

e. A complete copy of the approved APD shall be on location during
construction of the location and drilling activities.

f. There will be no deviation from the proposed drilling and/or workover
program without prior approval from the AO. Safe drilling and operating
practices must be observed. All wells, whether drilling, producing,
suspended, or abandoned will be identified in accordance with 43 CFR
3162.h.

g. "Sundry Notice and Report on Wells" (Form 3160-5) will be filed for
approval for all changes of plans and other operations in accordance with

43 CFR 3162.3-2.

h. This permit will be valid for a period of one year from the date of
approval. An extension period may be granted, if requested, prior to the
expiration of the original approval period.

i. The operator or his contractor shall contact the U.S. Forest Service at 801-
637-2817 48 hours prior to construction activities.

13. Lessee's or Operator's Representative and Certification

Permit Matters
Marion Energy Inc./Mid-Power Resource Corp.
Keri Clarke
l19 S. Tennessee Suite 200
McKinney, TX, 75069
(972)540-2967

Drilling & Completion Matters
Marion Energy Inc./Mid-Power Resource Corp.
2901 East 20 Street
Farmington, NM,
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Doug Endsley - VP Operations
(505)564-8005

Certification

I hereby certify that I, or Persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the
proposed drill site and access rout; that I am familiar with the conditions which

presently exist; that the statements made in this plan are, to the best of my
knowledge, true and correct; and, that the work associated with the operations
proposed herein will be performed by Anschutz Exploration Corp. and it's
contractors and subcontractors in conformity with the plan and the terms and

conditions under which it is approved.

This statement is subject to the provisions of 18.U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a
false statement

Date
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ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore

Federal and Indian Oil and Gas Leases
Ridge Runner #8-19

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas Order
No. 1, and the approved plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the
actions of his subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished the field
representative to insure compliance.

1. Estimated Tops/Geologic Markers

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Name TVD TD Production Phase
Top of Emery 1875ft 1893ft Gas
Top of Blue Gate 3050ft 3337ft Gas
Top of Ferron 5164ft 6211ft Gas
TD 5864ft 7162ft

2. Estimated Depth of Oil, Gas Water and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas
or other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation Depth
Gas Ferron 5164'

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling,
will be recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be
tested to determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sand will be reported to the BLM in Moab,
Utah. Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If noticeable water

flows are detected, samples will be submitted to the BLM along with any water
analyses conducted.

3. BOP Equipment

Marion Energy Inc's minimum specifications for pressure to control equipment

are as follows:

Ram Type: 11" Hydraulic double, 3000 psi
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Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approve stack
working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 70 percent of internal yield pressure
of casing. Pressure shall be maintained for at least 10 minutes or until
requirements of test are met, whichever is longer. If a test plug is utilized, no
bleed-off pressure is acceptable. For a test not utilizing a test plug, if a decline is
pressure of more than 10 percent in 30 minutes occurs, the test shall be considered
to have failed. Valve on casing head below test plug shall be open during test of

BOP stack.

Annular type preventers (if used) shall be tested to 60 percent of rated working
pressure. Pressure shall be maintained at least 10 minutes or until provisions of

test are met, whichever is longer.

As a minimum, the above test shall be performed:

a. when initially installed;
b. whenever any seal subject to test pressure is broken
c. following related repairs; and
d. at 40-day intervals

Valves shall be tested from working pressure side during BOPE tests with all
down stream valves open.

When testing the kill line valve(s) the check valve shall be held open or the ball
removed.

Annular preventers (if used) shall be functionally operated at least weekly.

Pipe and blind rams shall be activated each trip, however, this function need not
be performed more than once a day.

A BOPE pit level drill shall be conducted weekly for each drilling crew.

The BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimum requirements of
Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 for equipment and testing requirements,
procedures, etc., and individual components shall be operable ads designed.
Chart recorders shall be used for all pressure tests.

Pressure tests shall apply to all related well control equipment.

All of the above described tests and/or drills shall be recorded in the drilling log.
Test charts, with individual test results identified, shall be maintained on location
while drilling and shall be made available to a BLM representative upon request.

Pressure tests shall apply to all related well control
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BOP systems shall be consistent with API RP53. Pressure tests will be conducted

before drilling out from under casing strings which have been set and cemented in
place. Blowout preventer controls will be installed prior to drilling the surface

casing plug and will remain in use until the well is completed or abandoned.
Preventers will be inspected and operated at least daily to ensure good mechanical

working order, and this inspection will be recorded on the daily drilling report.

Preventers will be pressure tested before drilling casing cement plugs.

The Price River Resource Area Office shall be notified, at least 24 hours prior to
initiating the pressure test, in order to have a BLM representative on location
during pressure testing.

a. The size and rating of the BOP stack is shown on the attached diagram.
Although a rig has not been chosen to drill this well, most of the equipment

for this depth of hole in the area use a 11", 3000 psi working pressure blowout
preventor.

b. A choke line and a kill line are to be properly installed. The kill line is not to
be used as a fill-up line.

c. The accumulator system shall have a pressure capacity to provide for repeated
operation of hydraulic preventers.

d. Drill string safety valve(s), to fit all tools in the drill string, are to be
maintained on the rig floor while drilling operations are in progress.

4. Casing and Cementing Program
a. The proposed casing and cementing program shall be conducted as approved

to protect and/or isolate all usable water zones, potentially productive zones,
lost circulation zones, abnormally pressured zones, and any prospectively
valuable deposits of minerals. Any isolating medium other than cement shall
receive approval prior to use. The casing setting depth shall be calculated to
position the casing seat opposite a competent formation which will contain the
maximum pressure to which it will be exposed during normal drilling
operations. Determination of casing setting depth shall be based on all
relevant factors, including; presence/absence of hydrocarbons; fractured
gradients; usable water zones; formation pressures; lost circulation zones;

other minerals; or other unusual characteristics. All indications of usable
water shall be reported

b. Casing design shall assume formation pressure gradients of 0.44 to 0.50 psi
per foot for exploratory wells (lacking better data).

c. Casing design shall assume fracture gradients from 0.70 to 1.00 psi per foot
for exploratory wells (lacking better
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d. Casing collars shall have a minimum clearance of 0.422 inches of all sides in
the hole/casing annulus, with recognition that variances can be granted for
justifiedexceptions.

e. All waiting on cement times shall be adequate to achieve a minimum of 500
psi compressive strength at the casing shoe prior to drilling out.

f. All casing except the conductor casing, shall be new or reconditioned and
tested used casing that meets or exceeds API standards for new casing.

g. The surface casing shall be cemented back to surface either during the primary
cement job or by remedial cementing.

h. All indications of usable water shall be reported to the authorized officer prior
to running the next string of casing or before plugging orders are requested,
whichever occurs first.

i. Three centralizers will be run on the bottom three jointsof surface casing with
a minimum of one centralizer per joint starting with the shoe joint.

j. Top plugs shall be used to reduce contamination of cement by displacement
fluid. A bottom plug or other acceptable technique, such as a suitable preflush
fluid, inner string cement method, etc. shall be utilized to help isolate the
cement from contamination by the mud fluid being displaced ahead of the
cement slurry.

k. All casing strings below the conductor shall be pressured tested to 0.22 psi per
foot of casing string length or 1500 psi, whichever is greater, but not to exceed
70 percent of the minimum internal yield. If pressure declines more than 10
percent in 30 minutes, corrective action shall be taken.

m. On all exploratory wells, and on that portion of any well approved for 5M
BOPE system or greater, a pressure integrity test of each casing shoe shall be
performed. Formation at the shoe shall be tested to a minimum of the mud
weight equivalent anticipated to control the formation pressure to the next
casing depth or at total depth of the well. This test shall be performed before
drilling more than 20 feet of new hole.

n. The proposed casing program will be as follows:

Purpose Depth Hole Size O.D. Weight Grade Type New or Used
Surface 0-500' 14 3/4" 10 3/4"40.5# J-55 ST&C New
Intermed. 0-3350' 9 7/8" 7-5/8" 26.4# J-55 LT&C New
Produc. 0-7150' 7 7/8" 5-1/2" 17# J-55 LT&C New

o. Casing design subject to revision based on geologic conditions
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p. Please refer to DOGM Form 3 for the Cement program associated with this
well.

q. The price River Resource Area Office should be notified, with sufficient lead
time, in order to have a BLM representative on location while running all
casing strings and cementing.

r. After cementing but before commencing any test, the casing string shall stand
cemented until the cement has reached a compressive strength of at least 500
psi at the shoe. WOC time shall be recorded in the driller's log.

s. The following reports shall be filed with the District Manager within 30 days
after the work is completed.

1. Progress reports, Form 3160-5 (formerly 9-331) "Sundry
Notices and Reports on Wells", must include complete
information concerning:

a. Setting of each string of casing, showing the size,
grade, weight of casing set, hole size, setting depth,
amounts and type of cement used, whether cement
circulated or the top of the cement behind the casing,
depth of cementing tools used, casing test method and
results, and the date work was done. Show the spud
date on the first reports submitted.

b. Temperature of bond logs must be submitted for each
well where the casing cement was not circulated to the
surface.

t. Auxiliary equipment to be used is as follows:

1. Kelly cock

2. No bit float is deemed necessary.

3. A sub with a full opening valve.

5. Mud Program

a. The purpose circulating mediums to be employed in drilling are as follows:

Interval Mud Type Mud Wt. Visc. F/L PH
0-500' Spud Mud
500-3350' LSND 8.8-9.2 32-40 8-15
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3350'-T.D. Air/Foam N/A N/A N/A ---

There will be sufficient mud on location to control a blowout should one
occur.

A mud test shall be performed every 24 hours after mudding up to determine,
as applicable: density, viscosity, gel strength, static filtration loss, and Ph.

b. Mud monitoring equipment to be used is as follows:

1. Periodic checks will be made each tour of the mud system. The mud level
will be checked visually.

c. Hazardous substances specifically listed by the EPA as a hazardous waste or
demonstrating a characteristic of a hazardous waste will not be used in
drilling, testing or completion operations.

6. Evaluation Program

The anticipated type of amount of testing, logging and coring are as follows:

a. No drill stem tests are anticipated, however, if DST's are run, the following
requirements will be adhered to:

Initial opening of drill stem test tools shall be restricted to daylight hours
unless specific approval to start during other hours is obtained from the
authorized officer. However, DST's may be allowed to continue at night if
the test was initiated during daylight hours and the rate of flow is stabilized
and if adequate lighting is available (i.e. lighting which is adequate for
visibility and vapor-proof for safe operations). Packers can be released, but
tripping shall not begin before daylight, unless prior approval is obtained from
the authorized officer. Closed chamber DSTs may be accomplished day or
night.

A DST that flows to the surface with evidence of hydrocarbons shall be either
reversed out of the testing string under controlled surface conditions. This
would involve provided some means for reverse circulation.

Separation equipment required for the anticipated recovery shall be properly
installed before a test starts.

All engines within 100 feet of the wellbore that are required to "run" during
the test shall have spark arresters or water cooled exhausts.

b. The logging program will consist of the following log suites: Induction with
Gamma Ray and Spontaneous Potential, Compensated
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Neutron/Density with Photo Electric Caliper, and Ultrasonic Gas detector with
Temparature. Logs will be run from TD back to surface pipe.

c. Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well
Completion and Recompletion Report and Log' (Form 3160-4) will be
submitted no later than 30 days after completion of the well or after
completion of operations being performed, in accordance with 43 CFR 3164.
Two copies of all logs, core descriptions, core analyses, well-test data,
geologic summaries, sample description, and all other surveys or data
obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover, and/or completion
operations, will be filed with form3160-4. Samples (cuttings, fluids, and/or
gases) will be submitted when requested by the authorized officer (AO).

d. The anticipated completion program is as follows:

Perforate Ferron w/ 3-3/8" casing gun @6 jspf using 23 gram charges. Break
down formation with 2000 gallons of Formic acid. Fracture stimulate
formation w/ 25# Cross linked x-Linked Gel and 200,0001bs of 16/30 mesh
sand.

1. Anticipated Pressures and H,S

a. The expected bottom hole pressure is 1200 psi. Low pressures are anticipated.

b. No hydrogen sulfide gas is anticipated.

2. Other Information and Notification Requirements

a. Should the well be successfully completed for production, the AO will be
notified when the well is placed in a producing status. Such notification will
be sent by telegram or other written communications, not later than 5 days
following the date on which the well is placed on production.

b. Production data shall be reported to the MMS pursuant to 30 CFR 216.5 using
form MMS/3160.

c. The data on which production is commenced or resumed will be construed for
oil wells as the date on which liquid hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped
from a temporary storage facility, such as a test tank, and for which a run
ticket is required to be generated or, the date on which liquid hydrocarbons are
first produced into a permanent storage facility, whichever first occurs; and,
for gas wells as the date on which associated liquid hydrocarbons are first sold
or shipped from a temporary storage facility, such as a test tank, and for which
a run ticket is required to be generated or the date on which gas is first
measured though permanent metering facilities, whichever first
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d. Pursuant to NTL-4A, lessees or operators are authorized to vent/flare gas
during initial well evaluation tests, not exceeding a period of 30 days or the
production of 50 MMCF of gas, whichever occurs first. An application must
be filed with the District Engineer and approval received, for any
venting/flaring of gas beyond the initial 30 day or authorized test period.

e. Gas produced from this well may not be vented or flared beyond an initial
authorized test period of 30 days or 50 MMCF following its completion,
whichever occurs first, without the prior written approval of the Authorized
Officer. Should gas be vented or flared without approval beyond the
authorized test period, the operator may be directed to shut-in the well until
the gas can be captured or the operator shall be required to compensate the
lesser for that portion of the gas vented or flared without approval which is
determined to have been avoidably lost.

f. A schematic facilities diagram as required by 43 CFR 3162.7-2, 3162.7-3 and
3162.7-4 shall be submitted to the appropriate District Office within 30 days
of installation or first production, whichever occurs first. All site security
regulations as specified in 43 CFR 3162.7 and Onshore Order No.3 shall be
adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks
will be effectively sealed in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-4.

g. Section 102(b)(3) of the Federal Oil and Gas Royalty Management Act of
1982, as implemented by the applicable provisions of the operating
regulations at Title 43 CFR 3162.4-l(c), requires that "not later than the 5*

business day after any well begins production on which royalty is due
anywhere on a lease site or allocated to a lease site, or resumes production in
the case of a well which has been off production for more than 90 days, the
operator shall notify the authorized officer by letter or sundry notice, Form
3160-5, or orally to be followed by a letter or sundry notice, of the date on
which such production has begun or resumed."

If you fail to comply with this requirement in the manner and time allowed,
you shall be liable for a civil penalty of up to $10,000per violation for each
day such violation continues, not to exceed a maximum of 20 days. See
Section 109 (3) of the Federal Oil and Gas Royalty Management Act of 1982
and the implementing regulations at Title 43 CFR 3162.4-1(b)(5)(ii).

h. Drilling will commence on approximately June 30, 1996 to avoid wither
operations within the forest.

i. It is anticipated that the drilling of this well will take approximately 30 days.

j. No location will be constructed or moved, no well will be plugged, and no
drilling or workover equipment will be removed from a well to be placed in a
suspended status without prior approval of the AO. If operations are to
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suspended, prior approval of the AO will be obtained and notification given
before resumption of operations.

k. Immediate Report: Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents, or any other

unusual occurrences shall be promptly reported in accordance with the
requirements of NTL-3A or its revision.

1. If a replacement rig is contemplated for completion operations, a "Sundry
Notice" Form 3160-5 to that effect will be filed, for prior approval of the AO,
and all conditions of this approved plan are applicable during all operations
conducted with the replacement rig.

m. Pursuant to Onshore Order No. 7, with the approval of the District Engineer,
produced water may be temporarily disposed of into unlined pits for a period
of up to 90 days. During the period so authorized, and application for
approval of the permanent disposal method, along with the required water

analysis and other information must be submitted to the District Engineer.

n. No well abandonment operations will be commenced without the prior
approval of the AO. In the case of newly drilled dry holes or failures, and in
emergency situations, oral approval will be obtained from the SO> A
"Subsequent Report of Abandonment" Form 3160-5, will be filed with the AO
within 30 days following completion of the well for abandonment. This
report will indicate where plugs were placed and the current status of surface
restoration. Final abandonment will not be approved until the surface
reclamation work required by the approved APD or approved abandonment
notice has been completed to the satisfaction of the AO or his representative
or the appropriate Surface Managing
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Marion Energy Inc.

May 12, 2006

Utah Divisionof OilGas and Mining
ATTN: Diana Whitney
1594 West North Temple,Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah
84116

RE: Ridge Runner #11-18, #2-18, #11-17, #8-19, #1-30, #7-20
Marion Energy Inc., Sundry Notice
Clear Creek Unit 13S-7E and 14S-7E, Carbon and Emery Counties, Utah

Dear Ms. Whitney

Please find enclosed a sundrynotices pertaining to theabove referenced wells. The sundrynotice is
being filed due toa typingerrorfound in thecasing specificationson the Form 3. The same error was
present in thedrillingplan. This sundry notice serves to correct this error.

Ifyou require any further information, please do not hesitate tocontact me at (972) 540-2967 ext. 3004 or
emailbevans@marionenergy.com

Sincerely,

Benjamin Evans
Landman
Marion Energy Inc.

RECElVED
MAY15 2006

DIVOFOlL,GAS&MINING

119 South Tennessee, Suite 200, McKinney,TX, 75069
Telephone: (972) 540-2967

Fax: (972)
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STATEOFUTAH FORM9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERAL NUMBER:

USA-U-01740
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or t° Clear Creek Unit
drill horizontal laterais. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

L TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Ridge Runner #8-19

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Marion Energy Inc. 4301530682
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

119 S. Tennessee Ste. 200 cm McKinney TX y,, 75069 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1695ft FWL 1487ft FSL /SWl4 Section 20 14S-7E COUNTY: Emery

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NESW 20 14S 7E STATE:
UTAH

a CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATlON

O NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORAR1LYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL

(Submit Original Form Only)
CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion:
COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL S1TE OTHER: Correct typinq error

CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATlON On APD form 3

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

Please find attached to this sundry, a copy of a corrected APD form 9. The correction pertains to a typingerror found in the
specifications for casing in item number 24 on the form 9. The new amended report reflects the corrected specifications.

In the final paragraph of the original surface use plan, there was reference made to Anchutz Exploration Corp, this has now

been removed and Marion Energy Inc. has been replaced.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Benjamin Evans TITLE Landman

SIGNATURE DATE 5/12/2006

(This space for State use only)
siCO FederalunorovalOfThis

s and g nin9 ÃCilon is NBCOSSary MAY15 2006

(5/2000) tructions on Reverse
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 3
DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL,GAS AND MINING AMENDEDREPORT 2
(highlight changes)

5. MINERAL LEASE NO 6. SURFACE:

APPLICATION FOR PERMITTO DRILL USA-U-01740 Federal

1A. TYPE OF WORK: DRILL 2 REENTER DEEPEN
7. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:

8. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:
B. TYPE OF WELL: OIL GAS OTHER SINGLE ZONE 2 MULTIPLE ZONE O Clear Creek Unit

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

Mid-Power Resource Corporation Ridge Runner # 8-19
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

8290 W. Sahara, # 186 y., Las Vegas NV y 89117 (702) 838-0716 Wildcat
4. LOCATIONOF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

MERIDIAN:

ATSURFACE: 1695ft FWL 1487ft FSL /SWl4 Section 20 14S-7E NESW 20 14S 7E
AT PROPOSED PRODUCNGZONE: 747ft FEL 2211 ft FNL INE Section 19 14S-7E

14. DISTANCEIN MILESAND DIRECTIONFROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:

Approx 4 miles South West of Clear Creek and approx 9 miles South of Scofield Emeg
UTAH

15. DISTANCETO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE(FEET) 16. NUMBEROF ACRES IN LEASE: 17. NJMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:

Surface 1695ft Bottom Hole 747ft 1208.99 40
18. DISTANCETO NEAREST WELL(DRlLLING,COMPLETED, OR 19 PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:

APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET)

Surface 20ft Bottom Hole 2767ft 5,870 See Attached Bond Document
21. ELEVATIONS(SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATEDATEWORK WILLSTART: 23. ESTIMATEDDURA110N:

9815' GR 7/1/2006 30 days

24. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTINGPROGRAM

SlZE OF HOLE CASlNG SiZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHTPER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY,YIELD,AND SLURRYWEIGHT

17 1/2" 13 3/8" J-55 61# 500 Premium "G" 420 sks 1.25 cuft/sk 14.2 ppg

12 1/4" 8 5/8" J-55 36# 3,350 Lead: Prem. Lite 310 sks 3.82 cuft/sk 11 ppg

Tail: 50/50 Poz 75 sks 1.25 cuft/sk 14.2 ppg

7 7/8 5 1/2 J-55 17# 7,150 Lead: Prem. Lite 488 sks 3.82 cuft/sk 11 ppg

Tail: 50/50 Poz 275 sk 1.25 cuft/sk 14.2 ppg

25. ATTACHMENTS

VERIFYTHE FOLLOWNG ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCEWITH THE UTAHOILAND GAS CONSERVATIONGENERAL RULES:

WELL PLATOR MAPPREPARED BYLICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLINGPLAN

[¯]
EV1DENCEOF DIV1SIONOF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANYOTHER THANTHE LEASE OWNER

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Benjamin Evans TITLE Landman

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

API NUMBER ASSIGNED: APPROVAL: NAY152006
(11/2001) (See Instructions on Reverse
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Surface Use Plan
Mid-Power Resource Corporation

Ridge Runner #8-19

Thirteen Point Surface Use Plan

1. Existing Roads

a. The proposed well site is located approximately 15 miles south of Scofield,
Utah.

b. Directions to the location from Scofield, Utah are as follows:

From Scofield proceed south on Highway 96 for approximately 2.8 miles.
Turn west onto the Eccles Canyon Road (Highway 264) and proceed 4.1
miles. Turn left onto the Forest Service Road (#018)and proceed through a
gate and then in a southeasterly direction for approximately 8 miles. Turn
right onto the new access road and continue 0.1 miles to the location.

c. For location of access roads see Maps A & B.

d. Top map A is the vicinity map showing the access route from Scofield, Utah.

e. Topo map B shows the proposed access road to each well. It also shows
existing roads in the immediate area

f. Improvement to the existing Forest Service Road will require upgrading as
specified by the Forest Service.

g. All existing roads will be maintained and kept in good repair during all
drilling and completion operations associated with this well.

h. Existing roads and newly constructed roads on surface under the jurisdiction
of any Surface Managing Agency shall be maintained in accordance with the
standards of the SMA.

i. Road use permit # 0410-03-13 which expires June 16'2006 is currently being
renewed/extended. Maintenance of the access road will be conducted
according to conditions outlines in the referenced road use
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2. Planned Access Roads

a. The last 7.1 miles of access road will be upgraded to accommodate rig traffic.
The road will have a subgrade of 14 feet with a running surface of 12 feet.
Four inches of gravel will be placed on portions of the access road.

b. Surface disturbance and vehicular travel will be limited to the approved
location and approved access route. Any additional area needed will be
approved in advance.

3. Location of Existing Wells Within a 1-Mile Radius of the Proposed Location

a. Water wells - non

b. Injection wells - none

c. Producing wells - none

d. Drilling wells - none

e. Shut-in wells - Ridge Runner #11-20 & #13-17 (See Location Map L-1)

f. For reference please see topo map B

4. Location of Tank Batteries and Production Facilities

a. All permanent structures (onsite for six months or longer) constructed or
installed (including pump jacks) will be painted a neutral color to blend with
the surrounding environment. The proposed color for this site is Juniper
Green unless otherwise stipulated by the Forest Services. Facilities required
to comply with the Occupational Safety and Health Act (OSHA) will be
excluded.

b. If storage facilities/tank batteries are constructed on this lease, the
facility/battery or the wellpad shall be surrounded by a containment dike or
sufficient capacity to contain at a minimum, the entire content of the largest
tank within the facility/battery, unless more stringent protective requirements
are deemed necessary by the authorized officer.

c. All loading lines will be placed inside the berm surrounding the tank battery

d. Gas meter runs for each well will be located within 500 feet of the wellhead.
The gas flowline will be buried or anchored down from the wellhead to the
meter and 500 feet downstream of the meter run or any production facilities.
Meter runs will be housed and/or fenced. All buried pipelines shall
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covered to a depth of 3ft except at road crossings where they shall be covered
to a depth of 4ft.

e. The oil and gas measurement facilities will be installed on the well location.
The oil and gas meters will be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries.
Tests for meter accuracy will be conducted monthly for the first three months
on new meter installations and at least quarterly thereafter. The AO will be
provided with a date and time for the initial meter calibration and all future
meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will be
submitted to the Vernal District Office. All meter measurement facilities will
conform with Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 4 for liquid hydrocarbons and
Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 5 for natural gas measurement.

f. A production facility diagram is attached showing placement of all proposed
production facilities. (See survey outline A-3)

g. Any necessary pits will be properly fenced to prevent any wildlife entry.

h. All site security guidelines identified in 43 CFR 3162.7 regulations will be
adhered to.

i. All access roads will be maintained as necessary to prevent erosion and
accommodate year-round traffic.

j. The road will be maintained in a safe useable condition.

k. The site will require periodic maintenance to ensure that drainages are kept
open and free of debris, ice, and snow, and that surfaces are properly treated
to reduce erosion, fugitive dust, and impacts to adjacent areas.

l. The area used to contain the proposed production facilities will be built using
native materials. If these materials are not acceptable, then other
arrangements will be made to acquire them from private sources. These
facilities will be constructed using bulldozers, graders, and workman crews to
construct and place the proposed facilities.

5. Location and Water Supply

a. Any water to be used for the drilling of this well will be from the Price River
Water Improvement District (an adjudicated industrial water source) and
transported by a local trucking company (Nielson Construction).

b. No water wells are to be drilled.

6. Source of Construction Material

a. Surface and subsoil materials in the immediate area will be
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b. No construction materials are needed for drilling operations. In the event of
production, the small amount of gravel needed for facilities will be hauled in
by truck from a local gravel pit over existing access roads in the area. No
special access other than for drilling operations and pipeline construction is
needed.

c. The use of materials under BLM jurisdictionwill conform with 43 CFR
3610.2.3. Construction material will not be located on lease.

d. No construction materials will be removed from Federal land.

e. All access roads crossing BLM land is shown on topo map B.

7. Methods of Handling Waste Disposal

a. The reserve pit will be constructed so as not to leak, break, or allow discharge.
The reserve pit will be lined with a minimum 10mil plastic liner.

b. The reserve pit will be constructed of sufficient size and capacity for the
necessary fluids for drilling and to contain any runoff from the drill site. Pits
will not be constructed within intermittent or perennial stream channels.

c. No trash, scrap pipe, etc., that could puncture the liner will be disposed of in
the pit. Garbage and trash will be collected in a trash cage and its contents
hauled to a sanitary landfill. All wastes caused by the construction activities
shall be promptly removed and disposed of in a sanitary landfill or as directed
by the company representative.

d. The reserve pit will be constructed in undisturbed material and below the
natural ground level.

e. A minimum 2-foot freeboard will be maintained in the pit at all times during
the drilling operation and the pit will be fenced during drilling and completion
operations.

f. Burning will not be allowed. All trash will be contained in a trash cage and its
contents removed at the end of drilling operations and hauled to an approved
disposal sight.

g. After first production, produced waste water will be confined to a unlined pit
or storage tank for a period not to exceed ninety (90) days. During the 90-day
period, in accordance with Onshore Order No. 7, an application for approval
of a permanent disposal method and location, along with the required water
analysis, will be submitted for the AO's approval. Failure to file
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period, in accordance with Onshore Order No. 7, an application for approval
of a permanent disposal method and location, along with the required water
analysis, will be submitted for the AO's approval. Failure to file
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application within the time allowed will be considered an incident of
noncompliance.

h. Drill cuttings are to be contained and buried in the reserve pit.

i. Any salts and/or chemicals which are an integral part of the drilling system
will be disposed of in the same manner as the drilling fluid.

j. Sewage will be placed in a portable chemical toilet or holding tank and
disposed of in accordance with state and county regulations.

k. The produced fluids (other than water) will be produced into a test tank until
such time as construction of production facilities is completed. Any spills of
oil, gas, salt water or other produced fluids will be cleaned up and removed.

8 .Ancillary Facilities

There are no airstrips, camps, or other facilities planned during the drilling of the
proposed well.

9. Well Site Layout

a. All cut and fill slopes will be such that stability can be maintained for the life
of the activity. The upper edges of all cut banks on the access roads and well
pads will be rounded. Cut and fill slopes will be constructed as follows:

Height of Slope Slope
0-5 feet 3:1
6-10 feet 2:1
Over 10 feet 1-l/2:1

b. All fills will be free from vegetative materials and will be compacted in lifts
no greater than 12 inches in thickness to a minimum of 90 percent Proctor dry
density sufficient to prevent excessive settlement.

c. The working surface of the drill site will be surfaced with crushed gravel to a
depth sufficient to support anticipated loads throughout the life of the well.
Usually a depth of 12 inches of gravel is anticipated.

d. A diversion ditch having the minimum dimensions of 3 feet horizontal to 1
foot vertical (3:1 ditch), will be constructed around the site to divert surface
waters from flowing onto the site. The ditch will be located at the base of the
cut slope and around the toe of the fill slopes (see Drawing No. 1 -

Construction Requirements of Typical Well Sites). A straw dike will be
constructed in the ditch outflow to trap any sediment produced from the raw
slopes. A culvert will be necessary where the access road enters the
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e. A berm will be constructed around the perimeter of the site to contain all
precipitation, spills, and other fluids from leaving the site. The berm will be a
minimum of 18 inches high, 12 inches wide at the top, and having 1-l/2:1 side
slopes. The site surface will be graded to drain to the reserve pit. The
drainage pattern to be constructed will be modified for each site, depending on
the site specific conditions.

f. The reserve pit will be located on the east side of the location.

g. The stockpiled topsoil (first six inches or maximum available) will be stored
along the perimeter of the location as shown on the location platt.

h. See Location Layout for orientation of rig, cross section of drill pad and cuts
and fills. (See attached Platt A-4)

i. The location of mud tanks, reserve pit, trash cage, pipe racks, living facilities
and soil stockpiles will be shown on the Location Layout.

j. All pits will be fenced to prevent wildlife entry.

k. The reserve pit fencing will be on three sides during drilling operations and on
the fourth side when the rig moves off the location. Pits will be fenced and
maintained until cleanup. Reclamation will be undertaken no later than the
fall of the year after all drilling activity has ceased.

10. Plans for Restoration of Surface

Dry Hole

a. Rehabilitation of the entire site will be required and will commence
immediately after the drilling is complete. The site will be restored as nearly
practical to its original condition. Cut and fill slopes will be reduced and
graded to conform to the adjacent terrain.

b. Drainages will be reestablished and temporary measures will be required to
prevent erosion to the site until vegetation is established.

c. Generally speaking, the standpipe for well identifications will be removed on
National Forest lands. A final determination will be made on a case-by-case
basis.

d. After final grading and before the replacement of topsoil, the entire surface of
the site shall be scarified to eliminate slippage surfaces and to promote root
penetration. Topsoil will then be spread over the site to achieve
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approximate uniform, stable thickness consistent with the established
contours.

e. A temporary fence will be constructed around the site until vegetation is
established. The fence will then be removed.

f. At such time as the well is plugged and abandoned, the operator shall submit a
subsequent report of abandonment.

Producing Location

a. Site reclamation for producing wells will be accomplished for portions of the
site not required for the continued operation of the well. All disturbed surface
will be treated to prevent erosion and to complement the esthetics of the area.
A new site plan will be required encompassing the facilities required for
operation and interim reclamation measures.

b. Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area will be
cleared of all unused tubing, equipment, debris, materials, trash and junk not
required for production.

c. Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons on the pit shall be
removed in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-1.

d. The plastic nylon reinforced liner shall be torn and perforated before
backfilling of the reserve pit.

e. At the end of drilling operations, drilling fluids will be hauled to an approve
disposal site. All polluting substances or contaminated materials, such as oil,
oil-saturated soil, and gravel, will be buried within a minimum of 2 feet of
clean soil as cover or be removed from the Forest.

f. Once the reserve pit is dry, the reserve pit and that portion of the location not
needed for production facilities/operations will be recontoured to the
approximate natural contours.

g. The cut and fill slopes and all other disturbed areas not needed for the
production operation will be topsoiled and re-vegetated. The berm will be
removed and the site graded to drain.

h. The site will be seeded and/or planted as prescribed by the Forest Service.
This prescription will be determined prior to site construction on a site
specific basis. Nutrients and soil amendments will be applied to the
redistributed surface soil later as necessary to meet the re-vegetation
requirements. Fall seeding will be completed after September, and prior to
prolonged ground
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i. Annual or noxious weeds shall be controlled on all disturbed areas. Method
of control shall be by approved mechanical method or an Environmental
Protection Agency (EPA) registered herbicide. All herbicide application will
be in cooperation with Forest Service personel.

11. Surface Ownership

Access Roads - All roads are located within the Manti-La Sal National Forest.
Portions of the access road are located on private lands.

Well Pad - The well pad is located on lands managed by the Manti-La Sal
National Forest.

12. Other Information

a. A Class III cultural resource inventory will be completed prior to
disturbance by a qualified professional archaeologist.

b. The operator is responsible for informing all persons in the area who are
associated with this project that they will be subject to prosecution for
knowingly disturbing historic or archaeological sites, or for collecting
artifacts. If historic or archaeological materials are uncovered during
construction, the operator is to immediately stop work that might further
disturb such materials, and contact the authorized officer (AO). Within
five working days the AO will inform the operator to:

i. whether the materials appear eligible for the National Register of
Historic Places;

ii. the mitigation measures the operator will likely have to undertake
before the site can be used (assuming the site preservation is not
necessary); and

iii. a time frame for the AO to complete and expedited review under
36 CFR 800.11 to confirm, through the State Historic Preservation
Officer, that the findings of the AO are correct and that mitigation
is appropriate. If the operator wishes, at any time, to relocate
activities to avoid the expense of mitigation and/or the delays
associated with this process, the AO will assume responsibility for
whatever recordation and stabilization of the exposed materials
may be required. Otherwise, the operator will be responsible for
mitigation costs. The AO will provide technical and procedural
guidelines for the conduct of mitigation. Upon verification from
the AO that required mitigation has been completed, the operator
will then be allowed to resume
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c. Less than 10,000 pounds of any chemical(s) from the EPA's Consolidated
list of Chemicals Subject to Reporting Under Title III of the Superfund
Amendments and Reauthorization Act (SARA) Of 1986, as defined in 40
CFR, would be used, produces, transported, stored, disposed, or associated
with the proposed action.

d. All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that
full compliance is made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil
and Gas Orders, the approved plan of operations, and any applicable
Notice to Lessees. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his
subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished the field
representative to insure compliance.

e. A complete copy of the approved APD shall be on location during
construction of the location and drilling activities.

f. There will be no deviation from the proposed drilling and/or workover
program without prior approval from the AO. Safe drilling and operating
practices must be observed. All wells, whether drilling, producing,
suspended, or abandoned will be identified in accordance with 43 CFR
3162.h.

g. "Sundry Notice and Report on Wells" (Form 3160-5) will be filed for
approval for all changes of plans and other operations in accordance with
43 CFR 3162.3-2.

h. This permit will be valid for a period of one year from the date of
approval. An extension period may be granted, if requested, prior to the
expiration of the original approval period.

i. The operator or his contractor shall contact the U.S. Forest Service at 801-
637-2817 48 hours prior to construction activities.

13. Lessee's or Operator's Representative and Certification

Permit Matters
Marion Energy Inc./Mid-Power Resource Corp.
Keri Clarke
119 S. Tennessee Suite 200
McKinney, TX, 75069
(972)540-2967

Drilling & Completion Matters
Marion Energy Inc./Mid-Power Resource Corp.
2901 East 20th Street
Farmington, NM,
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McKinney, TX, 75069
(972)540-2967

Drilling & Completion Matters
Marion Energy Inc./Mid-Power Resource Corp.
2901 East 20th Street
Farmington, NM,



Doug Endsley - VP Operations
(505)564-8005

Certification

I hereby certify that I, or Persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the
proposed drill site and access rout; that I am familiar with the conditions which
presently exist; that the statements made in this plan are, to the best of my
knowledge, true and correct; and, that the work associated with the operations
proposed herein will be performed by Marion Energy Inc. and it's contractors and
subcontractors in conformity with the plan and the terms and conditions under
which it is approved.

This statement is subject to the provisions of 18.U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a
false statement.

Date
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH
2. CDW
3. FILE

X Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent/Operator

Operator Name Change Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 4/28/2006
FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2215-Mid-Power Resource Corporation N2740-Marion Energy, Inc.

8290 W Sahara Ave #186 119 S Tennessee, Suite 200
Las Vegas, NV 89117 McKinney, TX 75069

Phone: 1-(702) 838-0716 Phone: 1-(972) 540-2967

CA No. Unit: CLEAR CREEK

WELL(S)
NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL

NO TYPE TYPE STATUS
RIDGE RUNNER 13-17 17 140S 070E 4301530269 2550 Federal GW TA
RIDGE RUNNER 2-18 17 140S 070E 4301530683 Federal GW APD
RIDGE RUNNER 11-18 17 140S 070E 4301530684 Federal GW APD
RIDGE RUNNER 11-17 17 140S 070E 4301530685 Federal GW APD
RIDGE RUNNER 11-20 20 140S 070E 4301530271 2550 Federal GW TA
RIDGE RUNNER 1-30 20 140S 070E 4301530680 Federal GW APD
RIDGE RUNNER 7-20 20 140S 070E 4301530681 Federal GW APD
RIDGE RUNNER 8-19 20 140S 070E 4301530682 Federal GW APD

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 5/12/2006

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 5/8/2006

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 4/7/2005

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 5868337-0143

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

6a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

6b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a

Marion Energy 2 FORM 4A.xis
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7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 5/9/2006 BIA n/a

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: not yet

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: n/a

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 5/18/2006

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 5/18/2006

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 5/18/2006

4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 5/18/2006

5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: n/a

6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: 5/9/2006

FEDERAL WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: UTB000179

INDIAN WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: n/a

FEE & STATE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number n/a

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on:
The Division sent response by letter on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on:

COMMENTS:

Marion Energy 2 FORM 4A.xis
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-063018X

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 1FINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do not use this form for proposals todrill new wells, significantlydeepen existing wellsbelow currentbottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to Clear C k Unitdrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for suchproposals. ÛÛ

1 TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER ,,See Attachment "A

2 NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Marion Energy Inc. (N2740)
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WLDCAT:

119 S Tennessee Ste #200 on McKinney s ,,, TX ,75069 (972) 540-2967 Clear Creek Federal unit
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE N/A COUNTY Carbon and Emery

QTRIQTR. SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: N/A STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATlON
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Cleady show all peitinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

Marion Energy Inc. will take over operation of the Clear Creek Federal Unit which is currently operated by Mid-Power Resource
Corporation, and is located in both Carbon and Emery Counties Utah.

Please See attachment "A" for well Names, API numbers, and legal descriptions

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Keri Clar TITLE VICO Pf6Sident Land (Marion Energy Inc)

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED E & ô&
ownsve10aomo

(5/2000) ÛÎVÎSton of011,GasandMining (see instr 01005 On Reverse Side)

EarlenoRussell, EngineeringTechniciaa Û
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Attachment A
Marion Energy Inc.

Clear Creek Unit
Carbon and Emery Counties, Utah

Wells
Section
Township

Well Name API Number Status Ranae
Utah Fuel No. 1 43-007-16009-00-00 Shut-in S. 5 T14S R7E

Utah Fuel No. 2 43-007-16010-00-00 Shut-in S. 32 T13S R7E

Utah Fuel No. 3 43-007-16011-00-00 Shut-in S. 32 T13S R7E

Utah Fuel No. 4 43-007-16012-00-00 Shut-in S. 30 T13S R7E

Utah Fuel No. 5 43-007-16013-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 31 T13S R7E

Utah Fuel No. 8 43-007-16015-00-00 Shut-in S. 19 T13S R7E

Utah Fuel No. 10 43-007-16016-00-00 Shut-in S. 5 T14S R7E

Utah State M.L. 1256-1 43-007-30102-00-00 Shut-in S. 29 T13S 7E

Oman 2-20 43-007-30289-00-00 Shut-in S. 20 T13S R7E

Utah Fuel A-1 43-015-16021-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 6 T14S R7E

Alpine School District #6-17 43-007-31181-00-00 Permit not yet Approved S. 17 T13S R7E

Alpine School District #3-17 43-007-31182-00-00 Permit not yet Approved S. 17 T13S R7E

Ridge Runner 11-20 43-015-30271-00-00 Shut-in S. 20 T14S R7E

Ridge Runner 13-17 43-015-30269-00-00 Shut-in S. 17 T14S R7E

Ridge Runner #1-30 43-015-30680-00-00 Approved APD (NYS)* S. 20 T14S R7E

Ridge Runner #7-20 43-015-30681-00-00 Approved APD (NYS)* S. 20 T14S R7E

Ridge Runner #8-19 43-015-30682-00-00 Approved APD (NYS)* S. 20 T14S R7E

Ridge Runner #2-18 43-015-30683-00-00 Approved APD (NYS)* S. 17 T14S R7E

Ridge Runner #11-18 43-015-30684-00-00 Approved APD (NYS)* S. 17 T14S R7E

Ridge Runner #11-17 43-015-30685-00-00 Approved APD (NYS)* S. 17 T14S R7E
* Not Yet Spudded

Pluqqed Wells or Abandoned Well Sites in area (noted but not changed)
Clear Creek 1 43-007-20068-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 17 T14S R7E

Clear Creek Unit No. 16 43-015-16018-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 29 T14S R7E

Clear Creek Unit No. 17 43-015-30053-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 20 T14S R7E

GW Deck A-1 43-007-16008-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 8 T14S R7E

Gov't 1-17 43-007-11179-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S.17 T14S R7E

Keams A-1 43-015-11217-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 32 T14S R7E

Kemmerer Coal 1 43-015-10897-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 24 T14S R6E

Kemmerer Coal 2 43-015-10304-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 24 T14S R6E

C. K. Steiner A-1 43-015-10306-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 5 T15S R7E

Utah Fuel No. 7 43-007-16014-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 17 T13S R7E

H. E. Walton No. 1 43-007-16017-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 17 T14S R7E

H.E. Walton A-3 43-015-16023-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 30 T14S R7E

P. T. Walton No. 1-X 43-015-16024-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 19 T14S R7E

Clear Creek Water Well 1 43-007-20119-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 17 T14S R7E

Deck 1 43-007-20356-00-00 Location Abandoned S. 8 T14S R7E

Clear Creek U 18 43-007-30043-00-00 Location Abandoned S. 20 T13S R7E

1-18 43-015-20300-00-00 Location Abandoned S. 18 T14S R7E

P.T. Walton 1 43-015-20302-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 19 T14S R7E

Clear Creek Unit 1 43-015-30090-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 19 T14S R7E

Clear Creek (Deep) 2 43-015-30307-00-00 Location Abandoned S. 19 T14S
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Utah Fuel A-1 43-015-16021-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 6 T14S R7E

Alpine School District #6-17 43-007-31181-00-00 Permit not yet Approved S. 17 T13S R7E

Alpine School District #3-17 43-007-31182-00-00 Permit not yet Approved S. 17 T13S R7E

Ridge Runner 11-20 43-015-30271-00-00 Shut-in S. 20 T14S R7E

Ridge Runner 13-17 43-015-30269-00-00 Shut-in S. 17 T14S R7E

Ridge Runner #1-30 43-015-30680-00-00 Approved APD (NYS)* S. 20 T14S R7E

Ridge Runner #7-20 43-015-30681-00-00 Approved APD (NYS)* S. 20 T14S R7E

Ridge Runner #8-19 43-015-30682-00-00 Approved APD (NYS)* S. 20 T14S R7E

Ridge Runner #2-18 43-015-30683-00-00 Approved APD (NYS)* S. 17 T14S R7E

Ridge Runner #11-18 43-015-30684-00-00 Approved APD (NYS)* S. 17 T14S R7E

Ridge Runner #11-17 43-015-30685-00-00 Approved APD (NYS)* S. 17 T14S R7E
* Not Yet Spudded

Pluqqed Wells or Abandoned Well Sites in area (noted but not changed)
Clear Creek 1 43-007-20068-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 17 T14S R7E

Clear Creek Unit No. 16 43-015-16018-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 29 T14S R7E

Clear Creek Unit No. 17 43-015-30053-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 20 T14S R7E

GW Deck A-1 43-007-16008-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 8 T14S R7E

Gov't 1-17 43-007-11179-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S.17 T14S R7E

Keams A-1 43-015-11217-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 32 T14S R7E

Kemmerer Coal 1 43-015-10897-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 24 T14S R6E

Kemmerer Coal 2 43-015-10304-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 24 T14S R6E

C. K. Steiner A-1 43-015-10306-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 5 T15S R7E

Utah Fuel No. 7 43-007-16014-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 17 T13S R7E

H. E. Walton No. 1 43-007-16017-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 17 T14S R7E

H.E. Walton A-3 43-015-16023-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 30 T14S R7E

P. T. Walton No. 1-X 43-015-16024-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 19 T14S R7E

Clear Creek Water Well 1 43-007-20119-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 17 T14S R7E

Deck 1 43-007-20356-00-00 Location Abandoned S. 8 T14S R7E

Clear Creek U 18 43-007-30043-00-00 Location Abandoned S. 20 T13S R7E

1-18 43-015-20300-00-00 Location Abandoned S. 18 T14S R7E

P.T. Walton 1 43-015-20302-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 19 T14S R7E

Clear Creek Unit 1 43-015-30090-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 19 T14S R7E

Clear Creek (Deep) 2 43-015-30307-00-00 Location Abandoned S. 19 T14S

Attachment A
Marion Energy Inc.

Clear Creek Unit
Carbon and Emery Counties, Utah

Wells
Section
Township

Well Name API Number Status Ranae
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Utah Fuel No. 3 43-007-16011-00-00 Shut-in S. 32 T13S R7E
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P. T. Walton No. 1-X 43-015-16024-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 19 T14S R7E

Clear Creek Water Well 1 43-007-20119-00-00 Plugged and Abandoned S. 17 T14S R7E

Deck 1 43-007-20356-00-00 Location Abandoned S. 8 T14S R7E

Clear Creek U 18 43-007-30043-00-00 Location Abandoned S. 20 T13S R7E

1-18 43-015-20300-00-00 Location Abandoned S. 18 T14S R7E
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STA FE OF UTAH FORMS

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:ux-a- oé3otry

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME
Do notuse this¾rm ¾r proposals to drillnewwells,significantlydeepen existingWells below currentbotloiMiole depth, reenior plugged wells, orto

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPUCATION FOR PERMITTO DRILL¾rm for auchproposais. ŠL EA À É ÑË
1. TYPEOF WELL

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER
8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9 API NUMBER:

MM•$0ggA Â€GoufefL ÖOr ca.tl on)
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: 4 PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD ANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:

A )0 9. SA MMA Ñ¾ IffraTY Ms VEG A S STATE ZIP

4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: Ñ $ COUNTY: C'Maes3 MÞ EusAŸ

gTROTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: gg STATE:
UTAH

ii. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submt in Duplicale) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Appmximate data work willM CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCRON TEMPORARILYABANDON
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O SUBSEQUENT REPORT O CHANGEWELLNAME O PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submt Original Form Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date or workcompletion:
O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSTE O OTHER:

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLŒ - DIFFERENT FORMKDON

11 ŒSCRIBE PROPOSED COMPLETED OPER IONS Clearly s all pe details incitding d he

0 (

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) C. TITLE

SGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

APPROVE /
1EVED

, GasandMining DIVOF0lLGAS&MINING
Earlene Russell, Engineering
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United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Utah State Office TAK PRIOR*

P.O. Box 45155 IN ER$CA
Salt Lake City,UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
UT-922

May 9, 2006

Marion Energy Inc.
119 South Tennessee, Suite 200
McKinney, Texas 75069

Re: Clear Creek Unit
Carbon & Emery Counties, Utah

Gentlemen:

On May 8, 2006, we received an indenture dated April 28, 2006, whereby Mid-Power Resource
Corporation resigned as Unit Operator and Marion Energy Inc. was designated as Successor
Unit Operator for the Clear Creek Unit, Carbon & Emery Counties, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effective May 9, 2006.
In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the
designated party has obtained all required approval that would entitle it to conduct operations under
the Clear Creek Unit Agreement.

Your Utah statewide oil and gas bond No. UTBOOO179will be used to cover all federal operations
withinthe Clear Creek Unit.

It is requested that you notify all interested parties of the change in unit operator. Copies of the
approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriate federal offices,withone copy retumed
herewith.

Sincerely,

Is/ James A. Fouts

for Douglas F. Cook
Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure

bcc: Field Manager - Moab (wlenclosure)
SITLA
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
File - Clear Creek Unit (wlenclosure)
Agr. Sec. Chron RECEIVED
Reading File
Central Files $Ï 1 12006

UT922:TAThompson:tt:5/9/06 DIV.OFOlL,GAS&
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STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

Request to Transfer Application or Permit to Drill

(This form should accompany a Sundry Notice, Form 9, requesting APD transfer)

Well name: Ridge Runner # 8-19

API number: 4301530682

Location: NESW Sotor 20 owns 14S 7E

Company that filed original application: Mid-Power Resource Corporation

Date original permit was issued: 04/26/2006

Company that permit was issued to: Mid-Power Resource Corporation

Cheeck Desired Action:

Transfer pending (unapproved) Application for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property, hereby verifies that the information as
submitted in the pending Application for Permit to Drill, remains valid and does not require revision. The new
owner of the application accepts and agrees to the information and procedures as stated in the application.

/ Transfer approved Application for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted, hereby verifies that the
information as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require
revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verified. Yes No

If located on private land, has the ownership changed?

If so, has the surface agreement been updated?

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect the spacing or siting
requirements for this location?
Have there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permitting or operation of this
proposed well?
Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership or right-of-way, which could affect the
proposed location?

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed?

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a change in
plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation?

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? Bond No. BOO1617 /

Any desired or necessary changes to either a pending or approved Application for Permit to Drillthat is being transferred,
should be filed on a Sundry Notice, Form 9, or amended Application for Permit to Drill, Form 3, as appropriate, with
necessary supporting information as required.

Name (please int) Benjamin Evans---
- Title Landman

Signature Date 05/09/2006

Representing (company name arion Energy Inc.

The person signing this form must have legal authority to represent the company or individual(s) to be listed as the new operator on the Applicatíon for
Permit to Drilt

(3/2004)

MAYO9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

Request to Transfer Application or Permit to Drill

(This form should accompany a Sundry Notice, Form 9, requesting APD transfer)
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Cheeck Desired Action:

Transfer pending (unapproved) Application for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property, hereby verifies that the information as
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STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
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(February2005) IÌ'I -

Expires arch 31, 2007
UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR 5 LeaseSerialNo.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
gAg1149 P 2: 0

6 If Indian,Alloteeor TribeName
APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLOR REENTER

la. Typeof work: DRILL REENTER
7 IfUnitor CAAgrèement,NameandNo.

Clear Creek Unit

8 LeaseNameandWellNo
lb. Typeof Well: 06 Wen GasWell O er SingleZone MultipleZone Ridge Runner #8-19

2. Nameof Operator 9 APl WellNo.

3a. Address 8299W-Sansrir#tB6 II 7816 3b PhoneNo (inc co ) 10 Fieldan ool, orExploratoly

Û] ptg g
' WÛ-þgt Exploratory

4. Locationof Well(Report location clear and I withany Sure requimnens*) 11.Sec.,T.R.M. or Blk.andSurveyor Area

At surface 1735.948 FWL 1513.92ft FSL /SW/4 Section 20 14s-7E

At proposedprod zone 1230ft FEL 1935ft FNL INE/4 Section 19 145-7E( Bottom Hole)
NESW 20 14S 7E

14. Distanceinmiles and directionfromnearest townorpostonice• 12.CountyorParish 13 State
Approx 4 miles South West of Clear Creek and approx 9 miles South of Sconeld Emery UT

15. Distancefromproposed* Surface 1695ft 16. No.of acres inlease 17. SpacingUnitdedicatedtothiswell
locationtonearest
propertyor leaseline,ft
(Alsotonearestdrig.unitline,if any) Bottom Hole 1230ft 1208.99 40

18. Distancefromproposedlocation* 19.ProposedDepth 20. BLM/BIABondNa onfile
tonearestwell,drilling,completed,
appliedfor,on thislease,ft. Surface 208 BH 2767' 5,870ft

21. Elevations (Show whether DF,KDB, RT,GL etc.) 22 Approximatedateworkwill start* 23 Estimatedduration
9815' GR 07/15/2006 30 Days

24. Attachments

Thefollowing,completedinaccordance with therequirements of OnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1,must beattached tothisform:

1. Wellplatcertifiedbya registered surveyor. 4. Bondto coverthe operationsunlesscoveredby anexistingbondon file(see
1 A DrillingPlan. Item20above)

3. A SurfaceUse Plan(if the locationis on NationalForestSystemLands,the 5. Operatorcertification
SUPO must befiledwiththeappropriateForestServiceOffice). 6. Suchothersitespecificinformationand/orplansasmaybe required by the

BLM.

25. Signature Name(PdntedTyped) Date
Benjamin Evans 07/14/2006

Title
Landman

Approvedby (Signature) Name(PrinteR Date

Title ASSIStant Field Manager, o«,ce UlvsionofHesuultes

Applicationapprovald tw,APoÍcB1989Wer,gggtholdslegalorequitabletitletothos
n9ghtsbin

bj et ea
eewhichwouldentitletheapplicantto

conductoperationsthereon.
Conditionsofapproval,if any,areattached.

Title18U.S.C.Section1001andTitle43 U.S.C.Section1212,make ita crimeforany personknowinglyandwillfullytomake toanydepartmentor agency ofthe United
Statesany false,fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representationsas toanymatterwithinitsjurisdiction.

*(Instructions on page 2)

CONDITIONSOFAPPROVALATTAÑËEIVED

NOV17 2006
DIV.OFOlL,GAS&

9
a

Fonn3160-3 ED .;-

(February2005) IÌ'I -

Expires arch 31, 2007
UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR 5 LeaseSerialNo.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
gAg1149 P 2: 0

6 If Indian,Alloteeor TribeName
APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLOR REENTER

la. Typeof work: DRILL REENTER
7 IfUnitor CAAgrèement,NameandNo.

Clear Creek Unit

8 LeaseNameandWellNo
lb. Typeof Well: 06 Wen GasWell O er SingleZone MultipleZone Ridge Runner #8-19

2. Nameof Operator 9 APl WellNo.

3a. Address 8299W-Sansrir#tB6 II 7816 3b PhoneNo (inc co ) 10 Fieldan ool, orExploratoly

Û] ptg g
' WÛ-þgt Exploratory

4. Locationof Well(Report location clear and I withany Sure requimnens*) 11.Sec.,T.R.M. or Blk.andSurveyor Area

At surface 1735.948 FWL 1513.92ft FSL /SW/4 Section 20 14s-7E

At proposedprod zone 1230ft FEL 1935ft FNL INE/4 Section 19 145-7E( Bottom Hole)
NESW 20 14S 7E

14. Distanceinmiles and directionfromnearest townorpostonice• 12.CountyorParish 13 State

Approx 4 miles South West of Clear Creek and approx 9 miles South of Sconeld Emery UT

15. Distancefromproposed* Surface 1695ft 16. No.of acres inlease 17. SpacingUnitdedicatedtothiswell
locationtonearest
propertyor leaseline,ft
(Alsotonearestdrig.unitline,if any) Bottom Hole 1230ft 1208.99 40

18. Distancefromproposedlocation* 19.ProposedDepth 20. BLM/BIABondNa onfile
tonearestwell,drilling,completed,
appliedfor,on thislease,ft. Surface 208 BH 2767' 5,870ft

21. Elevations (Show whether DF,KDB, RT,GL etc.) 22 Approximatedateworkwill start* 23 Estimatedduration
9815' GR 07/15/2006 30 Days

24. Attachments

Thefollowing,completedinaccordance with therequirements of OnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1,must beattached tothisform:

1. Wellplatcertifiedbya registered surveyor. 4. Bondto coverthe operationsunlesscoveredby anexistingbondon file(see
1 A DrillingPlan. Item20above)

3. A SurfaceUse Plan(if the locationis on NationalForestSystemLands,the 5. Operatorcertification
SUPO must befiledwiththeappropriateForestServiceOffice). 6. Suchothersitespecificinformationand/orplansasmaybe required by the

BLM.

25. Signature Name(PdntedTyped) Date
Benjamin Evans 07/14/2006

Title
Landman

Approvedby (Signature) Name(PrinteR Date

Title ASSIStant Field Manager, o«,ce UlvsionofHesuultes

Applicationapprovald
tw,APoÍcB1989Wer,gggtholdslegalorequitabletitletothos

n9ghtsbin
bj et ea

eewhichwouldentitletheapplicantto

conductoperationsthereon.
Conditionsofapproval,if any,areattached.

Title18U.S.C.Section1001andTitle43 U.S.C.Section1212,make ita crimeforany personknowinglyandwillfullytomake toanydepartmentor agency ofthe United
Statesany false,fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representationsas toanymatterwithinitsjurisdiction.

*(Instructions on page 2)

CONDITIONSOFAPPROVALATTAÑËEIVED

NOV17 2006
DIV.OFOlL,GAS&

9
a

Fonn3160-3 ED .;-

(February2005) IÌ'I -

Expires arch 31, 2007
UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR 5 LeaseSerialNo.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
gAg1149 P 2: 0

6 If Indian,Alloteeor TribeName
APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLOR REENTER

la. Typeof work: DRILL REENTER
7 IfUnitor CAAgrèement,NameandNo.

Clear Creek Unit

8 LeaseNameandWellNo
lb. Typeof Well: 06 Wen GasWell O er SingleZone MultipleZone Ridge Runner #8-19

2. Nameof Operator 9 APl WellNo.

3a. Address 8299W-Sansrir#tB6 II 7816 3b PhoneNo (inc co ) 10 Fieldan ool, orExploratoly

Û] ptg g
' WÛ-þgt Exploratory

4. Locationof Well(Report location clear and I withany Sure requimnens*) 11.Sec.,T.R.M. or Blk.andSurveyor Area

At surface 1735.948 FWL 1513.92ft FSL /SW/4 Section 20 14s-7E

At proposedprod zone 1230ft FEL 1935ft FNL INE/4 Section 19 145-7E( Bottom Hole)
NESW 20 14S 7E

14. Distanceinmiles and directionfromnearest townorpostonice• 12.CountyorParish 13 State

Approx 4 miles South West of Clear Creek and approx 9 miles South of Sconeld Emery UT

15. Distancefromproposed* Surface 1695ft 16. No.of acres inlease 17. SpacingUnitdedicatedtothiswell
locationtonearest
propertyor leaseline,ft
(Alsotonearestdrig.unitline,if any) Bottom Hole 1230ft 1208.99 40

18. Distancefromproposedlocation* 19.ProposedDepth 20. BLM/BIABondNa onfile
tonearestwell,drilling,completed,
appliedfor,on thislease,ft. Surface 208 BH 2767' 5,870ft

21. Elevations (Show whether DF,KDB, RT,GL etc.) 22 Approximatedateworkwill start* 23 Estimatedduration
9815' GR 07/15/2006 30 Days

24. Attachments

Thefollowing,completedinaccordance with therequirements of OnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1,must beattached tothisform:

1. Wellplatcertifiedbya registered surveyor. 4. Bondto coverthe operationsunlesscoveredby anexistingbondon file(see
1 A DrillingPlan. Item20above)

3. A SurfaceUse Plan(if the locationis on NationalForestSystemLands,the 5. Operatorcertification
SUPO must befiledwiththeappropriateForestServiceOffice). 6. Suchothersitespecificinformationand/orplansasmaybe required by the

BLM.

25. Signature Name(PdntedTyped) Date
Benjamin Evans 07/14/2006

Title
Landman

Approvedby (Signature) Name(PrinteR Date

Title ASSIStant Field Manager, o«,ce UlvsionofHesuultes

Applicationapprovald
tw,APoÍcB1989Wer,gggtholdslegalorequitabletitletothos

n9ghtsbin
bj et ea

eewhichwouldentitletheapplicantto

conductoperationsthereon.
Conditionsofapproval,if any,areattached.

Title18U.S.C.Section1001andTitle43 U.S.C.Section1212,make ita crimeforany personknowinglyandwillfullytomake toanydepartmentor agency ofthe United
Statesany false,fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representationsas toanymatterwithinitsjurisdiction.

*(Instructions on page 2)

CONDITIONSOFAPPROVALATTAÑËEIVED

NOV17 2006
DIV.OFOlL,GAS&



Ridge llunner #8-19
Footage Calls

Surface: 1735.94ft FWL 1513.92ft FSL /SWl4 Section 20 14s-7E

Ferron Point of Penetration: 750ft FEL 2190ft FNL /NE/4 Section 19 14S-7E

Terminus (Bottom Hole): 1230ft FEL 1935ft FNL /NE/4 Section 19
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Marion Energy, Inc.
Ridge Runner No. 8-19
Clear Creek Unit
Lease, Surface: UTU-02353

Bottom-hole: UTU-01740
Location, Surface: NE/SW Sec. 20, T14S, R7E

Bottom-hole: SEINE Sec. 19, T14S, R7E
(Located on the existing Ridge Runner #11-20 well pad with proposed wells #7-20 and #1-30)
Carbon County, Utah

A COMPLETE COPY OF THIS APPROVED PERMIT and Conditions of Approval shall be
maintained on location during all construction and cirilling operations, and shall be
available to contractors to ensure compliance.

CONDITIONSOF APPROVAL

Approval of this application does not warrant or certifythat the applicant holds legal or equitable
title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations
thereon.

Be advised that Marion Energy, Inc. is considered to be the operator of the above well and is
responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease for the operations conducted on the
leased lands.

Bond coverage for this well is provided by UTB000179 (Principal - Marion Energy, Inc.) via
surety consent as provided for in 43 CFR 3104.2.

This office will hold the aforementioned operator and bond liable until the provisions of
43 CFR 3106.7-2 continuing responsibility are met.

This permit will be valid for a period of one year from the date of approval. After permit
termination, a new application must be filed for approval.

All lease operations will be conducted in full compliance withapplicable regulations
(43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas Orders, lease terms, notices to lessees, and the approved
plan of operations. Deviation from the approved plan is not allowed. The operator is fully
responsible for the actions of his subcontractors.

Failure to comply with the provisions of this permit, including applicable regulations, stipulations,
and/or approval conditions, will be considered a violation subject to the enforcement provisions
of 43 CFR Subpart 3163.

Ifat any time the facilities located on National Forest lands authorized by the terms of the lease
are no longer included in the lease (due to a contraction on the unit or other lease or unit
boundary change), the US Forest Service (USFS) will process a change in authorization to the
appropriate statute. The authorization will be subject to appropriate rental or other financial
obligation determined by the
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A. DRILLINGPROGRAM

1. The proposed 3M BOP system is adequate for anticipated conditions.
Installation, testing and operation of the system shall be in conformance with
Onshore Oiland Gas Order No. 2.

2. Concurrent approval from the State of Utah, Division of Oil,Gas & Mining
(DOGM) is required before conducting any surface disturbing activities.

3. Surface casing shall be cemented to surface.

4. Drilling reports, which describe the activities of each day, shall be submitted to
the BLM Moab Field Officeon a weekly, or more frequent, basis. In addition to a
daily summary of activities, drilling reports shall include the drilling fluid weight,
details of casing and cement, water flows, lost circulation zones and any other
information that would contribute to our understanding of drilling conditions.

5. The intermediate casing shall be cemented into place such that the top-of-cement
extends a minimumof 100 feet into the surface casing, leaving no annular space
exposed to open-hole above the intermediate casing shoe. The top-of-cement
shall be verified by a cement bond log (CBL), temperature survey or other
appropriate tool for determining top-of-cement, unless cement is circulated to
surface.

6. If logging reveals that the cementing objectives were not met, remedial cementing
willbe required.

7. The requirements for air drilling, found in Onshore Oiland Gas Order No. 2, part
III, E (Special Drilling Operations), shall be followed. This section requires, at a
minimum,the use of the following equipment:

- Rotating Head
- Spark arresters
- Blooie line discharge 100 feet from wellbore
- Straight blooie line
- Deduster equipment
- Float valve above bit
- Automatic igniter on the blooie line

8. A directional survey shall be submitted within 30-days of reaching total depth of
the
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B.SURFACE

1. The Forest must be notified 48 hours in advance that heavy equipment will
' be moved onto National Forest system lands and that surface disturbing

activities will commence.

2. The Forest Service must be notified of any proposed alterations to the

plan of operations. Any changes to the existing plan are subject to

Forest Service review and approval,

3. The licensee/permittee/lessee must cömply with all the rules and

regulations of the Secretary of ABriculture set forth at Title 36, Chapter

II, of the Code of Federal Regulations Governing the use and manasement of

the National Forest System (NFS) when not inconsistent with the rights and

regulations must be complied with for (1) all use and occupancy of the NFS

prior to approval of a permit/operation plan by the Secretary of the

Interior, (2) uses of all existing improvements, such as Forest

Development Roads, within and outside the area licensed, permitted or

leased by the Secretary of the Interior, and (3) use and occupancy of the

NFS not authorized by a permit/operating plan approved by the Secretary of

the Interior.

4. All merchantable timber removed or destroyed by construction or other

project related activities will be purchased by the operator .at
fair

market value. The Forest Service will conduct a timber cruise and

appraisal after the final clearing limits have been staked, Slash burnirig

will be conducted only at locations approved by the Forest Service under

authorization or a burning permit. Burning of garbage and debris is

prohibited.

5. All accidents or mishaps resultin5 in resource damage and/or serious

personal injury must be reported to the Forest Service. as soon as

possible.

6. Section corners, survey markers and claim corners in.the project area must

bë located and flaß5ed by the operator prior to operations. The removal

or disturbance of identified markers must be approved by the - proper

authority.

7. All surface-disturbing activities, including reclamation, huat be

supervised by a -qualified,
responsible official or representative of the

designated operator who is aware of the terms and conditions of the

APD/SUPO and specifications in the approved plans.

8. In the event of a.discovery, a revised surface-use plan must be submitted

to the Forest Service showing all needed production facilities.

Production facilities will be subject to further.euvironmental analyses

and approval by the Forest Service.

9. Establishment of campsites on the pad or at other locations on National

Forest System lands by the operator or his contractors is subject to

Forest Service approval.

10. Fire suppression equipment must be available to all personnel working at

the project site. Equipment must include at least one hand tool per crew

member consisting of shovels and pulaskis and one properly rated fire

extinguisher per vehicle and/or internal combustion engine.

11, All gasoline, diesel, and.steam-powered equipment must be equipped with
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member consisting of shovels and pulaskis and one properly rated fire

extinguisher per vehicle and/or internal combustion engine.

11, All gasoline, diesel, and.steam-powered equipment must be equipped with



effective eþään aireitär or mufžier. spark arresters must meet Forest

service specifications discussed in the "General.Purpose and Löcomotive

(GP/L) Spark Arrester Guide, Volume 1, April, 1988"; and "Multi-position

small Engine (MSE) Spark Arrest'er Guide, April, 1989". In addition, all
electrical equipment must be properly insulated to prevent sparks.

12. Anschutz will be held responsible for damage and suppression costs for

fires started as a result of operations. Fires must be reported to the

Forest Service as soon as possible.

13. The Forest Service reserves the right to suspend operations during periods

of high fire potential.

14. The Memorandum of Understanding with the state of Utah Air Conservation

Committee will be implemented. This will assure project implementation
activities meet the state ,and Federal Air quality standards.

15. Reclamation recontouring and reseeding of disturbed areas will be

performed as soon as practicable (within the same drilling season).

16. Seeding will be performed using the certified seed mix listed below. The

seed mixture must meet or exceed the pure live seed standards of the Utah

Seed Law containing a maximum allowable weed content of less than 2

percent with no noxious weed species.

Species . Pounds/Acre

Mountain Brome - Bromus carinatus 2

Intermediate Wheatgrama - Agropyron intermedium 2
Orchard Grass - Dactylis glomerata 2

Perennial Ryegrass - Lolium perenne 2

Timothy - Phleum pratense 2

Cicer Milkvetch - Astragalue citer 1/4

TOTAL -

10-1/4

17. Revegetation will be considered successful when 90% of the pre-disturbance

ground cover is re-established over the entire disturbed area. Adjacent

undisturbed areas will be used as a base for comparison. Of the

vegetative ground cover, at least sot must consist of seeded or other

desirable species. 904 ground cover must be maintained for three years.

If the desired ground cover is not established at the end of each 3 year

period, an analysis of why the area has not recovered will be performed by

the operator and additional treatment-and seeding will be required based

on the results of the analysis.

18. An erosion and sediment control plan will be prepared as prescribed in the

Soil and Water conservation practices Handbook. During operations the

operator shall maintain seasonal erosion control structures.

19. All Topsoil must be stripped from areas to be disturbed and stockpiled for

reclamation in such a way as to prevent soil loss and contamination.

20. Follooiing completion of the project, the pad and project area must be
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recontoured to blend naturally with the surrounding area. Gravel will be
salvaged and stockpiled in an area approved by the Forest Service.

21. The reserve pit must be dry before at is backfilled and reclaimed.
Methods for drÿing the pit, other than natural evaporation, are subject to
prior Forest Service approval.

22. The pad area must be fenced (let-down fence) and the project road must be
adequately closed off to .preVent continued use ,until the required
reclamation standards are successfully achieved.

23. Livestock may be temporarily excluded from disturbed areas through fencing
or other appropriate measures in critical sections.

24. The operator is responsible for maintenance of reclamation facilities auch
as fences, barricades and temporary drainage structures until the desired
reclaimed conditions are achieved.

25. The operator shall submit for approval, a maintenance plan for the site,
the project road and that portion of any Forest Development Road to be
used for project access. A road-use permit must be obtained from the
Forest Service authorizing commercial use of Forest Development Roads.
Requirements listed in the road-use permit must be followed. In the event
of a discovery, an updated maintenance plan will be required.

26. The pad and road designs must be consistent with Forest service
specifications as outlined in the Region 4 011 and Gas Roading Guidelines
(Attachment 1) and the Manti-La sal National Forest Oil and Gas Well Site

Guidelines (Attachment 2) and are subject to Forest service approval. No
construction operations may begin prior to approval. Any mo4ifications to
approved plans are also subject to review and approval.

27. All vehicle traffic will stay on existing roads and new access routes.
Unauthorized off-road vehicular travel is prohibited.

28. A pre-construction meeting including the ,
responsible company

representativets), contractors, and the Forest Service must be .conducted

at the project site prior to commencement of sur£ace-di'sturbing
activities. The pad and road work must be construction-staked prior to
this meeting. Site-specific requirements will be discussed at .this time.

29. The operator must acquire appropriate permission to use roads not
identified as Forest Development Roads.

30. The project engineer and surveyors must be certified by the State in which
they reside or maintain their business.

31. A gate must be constructed on the pad access roads near the intersection
with Forest Development Road 50018 to prevent public access to the pads.
The gate must be locked at any time that the pad is unoccupied by company
personnel. The gate design must be approved by the Forest service.

32. .Surface aggregate will be designed to be stable and meet wear requirements
contained La Forest Service Specifications for Construction of Roads and
Minor Drainage Structures, section 703.06.

33. Drill pads will be designed to prevent or diminish overland flow from
entering the site during precipitation events. Pad sites will be sloped

Stipulations, Page

recontoured to blend naturally with the surrounding area. Gravel will be
salvaged and stockpiled in an area approved by the Forest Service.

21. The reserve pit must be dry before at is backfilled and reclaimed.
Methods for drÿing the pit, other than natural evaporation, are subject to
prior Forest Service approval.

22. The pad area must be fenced (let-down fence) and the project road must be
adequately closed off to .preVent continued use ,until the required
reclamation standards are successfully achieved.

23. Livestock may be temporarily excluded from disturbed areas through fencing
or other appropriate measures in critical sections.

24. The operator is responsible for maintenance of reclamation facilities auch
as fences, barricades and temporary drainage structures until the desired
reclaimed conditions are achieved.

25. The operator shall submit for approval, a maintenance plan for the site,
the project road and that portion of any Forest Development Road to be
used for project access. A road-use permit must be obtained from the
Forest Service authorizing commercial use of Forest Development Roads.
Requirements listed in the road-use permit must be followed. In the event
of a discovery, an updated maintenance plan will be required.

26. The pad and road designs must be consistent with Forest service
specifications as outlined in the Region 4 011 and Gas Roading Guidelines
(Attachment 1) and the Manti-La sal National Forest Oil and Gas Well Site

Guidelines (Attachment 2) and are subject to Forest service approval. No
construction operations may begin prior to approval. Any mo4ifications to
approved plans are also subject to review and approval.

27. All vehicle traffic will stay on existing roads and new access routes.
Unauthorized off-road vehicular travel is prohibited.

28. A pre-construction meeting including the ,
responsible company

representativets), contractors, and the Forest Service must be .conducted

at the project site prior to commencement of sur£ace-di'sturbing
activities. The pad and road work must be construction-staked prior to
this meeting. Site-specific requirements will be discussed at .this time.

29. The operator must acquire appropriate permission to use roads not
identified as Forest Development Roads.

30. The project engineer and surveyors must be certified by the State in which
they reside or maintain their business.

31. A gate must be constructed on the pad access roads near the intersection
with Forest Development Road 50018 to prevent public access to the pads.
The gate must be locked at any time that the pad is unoccupied by company
personnel. The gate design must be approved by the Forest service.

32. .Surface aggregate will be designed to be stable and meet wear requirements
contained La Forest Service Specifications for Construction of Roads and
Minor Drainage Structures, section 703.06.

33. Drill pads will be designed to prevent or diminish overland flow from
entering the site during precipitation events. Pad sites will be sloped

Stipulations, Page

recontoured to blend naturally with the surrounding area. Gravel will be
salvaged and stockpiled in an area approved by the Forest Service.

21. The reserve pit must be dry before at is backfilled and reclaimed.
Methods for drÿing the pit, other than natural evaporation, are subject to
prior Forest Service approval.

22. The pad area must be fenced (let-down fence) and the project road must be
adequately closed off to .preVent continued use ,until the required
reclamation standards are successfully achieved.

23. Livestock may be temporarily excluded from disturbed areas through fencing
or other appropriate measures in critical sections.

24. The operator is responsible for maintenance of reclamation facilities auch
as fences, barricades and temporary drainage structures until the desired
reclaimed conditions are achieved.

25. The operator shall submit for approval, a maintenance plan for the site,
the project road and that portion of any Forest Development Road to be
used for project access. A road-use permit must be obtained from the
Forest Service authorizing commercial use of Forest Development Roads.
Requirements listed in the road-use permit must be followed. In the event
of a discovery, an updated maintenance plan will be required.

26. The pad and road designs must be consistent with Forest service
specifications as outlined in the Region 4 011 and Gas Roading Guidelines
(Attachment 1) and the Manti-La sal National Forest Oil and Gas Well Site

Guidelines (Attachment 2) and are subject to Forest service approval. No
construction operations may begin prior to approval. Any mo4ifications to
approved plans are also subject to review and approval.

27. All vehicle traffic will stay on existing roads and new access routes.
Unauthorized off-road vehicular travel is prohibited.

28. A pre-construction meeting including the ,
responsible company

representativets), contractors, and the Forest Service must be .conducted

at the project site prior to commencement of sur£ace-di'sturbing
activities. The pad and road work must be construction-staked prior to
this meeting. Site-specific requirements will be discussed at .this time.

29. The operator must acquire appropriate permission to use roads not
identified as Forest Development Roads.

30. The project engineer and surveyors must be certified by the State in which
they reside or maintain their business.

31. A gate must be constructed on the pad access roads near the intersection
with Forest Development Road 50018 to prevent public access to the pads.
The gate must be locked at any time that the pad is unoccupied by company
personnel. The gate design must be approved by the Forest service.

32. .Surface aggregate will be designed to be stable and meet wear requirements
contained La Forest Service Specifications for Construction of Roads and
Minor Drainage Structures, section 703.06.

33. Drill pads will be designed to prevent or diminish overland flow from
entering the site during precipitation events. Pad sites will be sloped

Stipulations, Page



to drain all spills and on-site precipitation into the reserve pits. If
necessary, pits will be pumped out to reduce their content and insure that
overflow does not occur, Fluide will be disposed of off-Forest at a Utah

,State approved disposal site.

34. The operator must take reasonable precautions when setting surface casing.
to prevent excessive migration of cement in fracture systems that could
disrupt the flow and quality of water at springs in the vicinity of the
well, Measures such as use of high-viscosity cement and non-polluting
additives should be considered.

35. Water needed in support of operations must be properly and legally
obtained according to Utah State water laws. The location of diversion,
it on National Forest System lands, is subject to Forest Service approval.

36. sanitary facilities are required on site at all times during operations.
The installation of facilities other than self-contained chemical toilets
is subject to state and Forest Service approval.

37. Unless otherwise specified in the Forest Service conditions for approval
the surface-Use Plan of Operations, contaminated soils and gravel in the
project area and the contents of the reserve pit, including the liner
material, will be removed from the National Forest and disposed of at an
approved facility. Exceptions may be granted it the operator can
denumstrate non-toxicity through testing or isolation through
encapsulation.

38. Before construction, reconstruction, or operation activities can commence,
the operator must file a spill contingency plan with the Forest Service.
The plan must identify the.potential for spills to occur, activities that
could result in spills, substances that oculd be spilled, identify
appropriate containment/cleanup actions, and identify equipment/materials
to be be maintained in vehicles and at the drilling pad to contain or
neutralize spilled waterials. The plan must iðentify potentially affected
parties, required contacts, and time frames for cleanup in the event of a
spill. The plan must be consistent with the United States Environmental
Protection Agency Region VIII Oil and Hazarddus Substances Regional
Contingency Plan.

39. Anschutz will monitor water quality. Anschutz will develop and submit a
water monitoring plan to be approved by the Forest service. The plan will
identity the monitoring objective(s), items to monitor, monitoring sites,
methodology, frequency and duration, analysis and reporting procedures,
projected costs, arui monitoring responsibility. Project implementation
will not be permitted until the monitoring plan is approved.

40 . Sediment catchment structures will be added below critical construction
areas to reduce sedimentation.

41. Liyestock may be temporarily excluded from disturbed areas through
let-down fencing or other appropriate measures in critical sections above
Burnout and James

.

Canyons .

42. Warning signs will be installed at the entrance to road construction or
reconstruction projects, at the junction of Forest development roads and
work roads, .aux! near dispersed camp areas 1/4 mile froé drilling
operations to alert hunters and other Forest users to the presence of
working equipment and crews.
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43. Drill riga and heavy equipment shall NOT be transported in or out of the
Trough springs Ridge area on FDR 50018 during Federal and State holiday
weekends. (For example, equipment may not be mobilized on a typical
holiday weekend beginning noon on Friday through noon the following
Tuesday.)

44. Drill rigs and heavy equipment shall NOT be transported in or out.of the
Trough Springs Ridge area on FDR 50018 .during the opening days of the
general elk hunt (on or about september 28 through October 2) and deer
hunt (on or about October 14 through 17).

45. Road improvement and pad development activities will not begin until
Monday, July Sth to avoid impacts to elk in their spring ranges.

46. Anschuts will construct a traffic barrier, obliterate, and reseed
nonsystem roads not needed for future management adjacent to the Trough
springs Road. Approximate miles to be improved include nonsystem
ridgeline roada leading into North and south Hughes Canyons (0.25 miles
each) and a loop road at the head of Valentine Canyon (0.5 miles). Forest
Service will supply and install sign posts to inform the public of road
closure.

47. Apachuts shall repair watershed contour furrows damaged during exploration
operations as approved by the Forest Service.

48. Drilling operations shall be coordinated with grazing permittees.

49. Gates must be closed after entry unless otherwise specified.

50. Anschuts will be held responsible for all damage to fences, cattleguards,
resource improvements, roads, and other structures on National Forest
System lands which result from their operations. The Forest Service must
be notified of damages as soon as possible.

51. Harassment of livestock and wildlife is prohibited.'

52. The operator will assure (certify) all drilling equipment, vehicles, and
all fill materials, including road aggregate imported..to National Forest
System lands for the purpose of construction, operation, and maintenance
of the roads and pada must be free of noxious weeds and seeds prior to
entering upon Forest Service lands. The operator will be held responsible
for control of noxious weed intestations within areas they disturb ie.
drill pads and roads.

53. Straw, hay, or feed used on the National Forest's of Utah must be
certified weed-free by the State of Utah.

54. Surveys for new goshawk nesting territories will be conducted in areas of
suitable habitat the year prior to and during implementation. The
operator will be notified of the results of the surveys with any special
requirements for protecting them, if any are present.

55. If cultural or paleontological resources are found during implementation
of the project, operations will immediately cease at that locati'on and the
District Ranger will be notified. Unauthorized excavation,.removal, or
damage of archaeological resources is subject to fines and other penalties
under authority of the Archaeological Resources Protection Act
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for control of noxious weed intestations within areas they disturb ie.
drill pads and roads.

53. Straw, hay, or feed used on the National Forest's of Utah must be
certified weed-free by the State of Utah.

54. Surveys for new goshawk nesting territories will be conducted in areas of
suitable habitat the year prior to and during implementation. The
operator will be notified of the results of the surveys with any special
requirements for protecting them, if any are present.

55. If cultural or paleontological resources are found during implementation
of the project, operations will immediately cease at that locati'on and the
District Ranger will be notified. Unauthorized excavation,.removal, or
damage of archaeological resources is subject to fines and other penalties
under authority of the Archaeological Resources Protection Act



C. REQUIRED APPROVALS,REPORTS AND NOTIFICATIONS

Required verbal notifications are summarized in Table 1, attached.

Building Location- Notify the Forest Service, Ferron Ranger District Officeat least 48-hours prior
to commencing construction of location.

Spud- Notify the BLM Price Field Office24-hours prior to spud. Submit written notification
(Sundry Notice, Form 3160-5) to the BLM Moab Field Officewithin24-hours after spud,
regardless of whether using a dry hole digger or big rig.

Daily Drillinq Reports- Daily drilling reports that describe the progress and status of the well shall
be submitted to the BLM Moab Field Office on at least a weekly basis. This report may be in any
format customarily used by the operator.

Oiland Gas Operations Reports (OGORs)- Production from this well shall be reported to
Minerals Management Service (MMS)on a monthly basis.

Sundry Notices- Any modification to the proposed drilling program shall be submitted to the BLM
Moab Field Officeon a Sundry Notice (Form 3160-5). Regulations at 43 CFR 3162.3-2 describe
which operations require prior approval, and which require notification.

Drilling Suspensions- Operations authorized by this permit shall not be suspended for more than
30 days without prior approval of the BLM Moab Field Office. AII conditions of this approval shall
be applicable during any operations conducted with a replacement rig.

Undesirable Events- Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents, or any other unusual occurrences
shall be immediately reported to the BLM in accordance with requirements of NTL-3A.

Cultural Resources- Ifcultural resources are discovered during construction, immediately notify
the Forest Service, Ferron Ranger District Office,and work that might disturb the cultural
resources shall cease.

First Production- A first production conference willbe scheduled as soon as the productivity of
the well is apparent. This conference should be coordinated through the Forest Service, Ferron
Ranger District Office.

Notify the BLM Moab Field Officewhen the well is placed into production. Initial notification may
be verbal, but must be confirmed in writingwithin five business days. Please include the date
production started, the producing formation and production volumes.

Well Completion Report- Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, a Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log (Form 3160-4) shall be submitted to the BLMMoab
Field Office withinthirty-daysafter completion of the well. Two copies of all logs, core
descrlptions, core analyses, welltest data, geologic summaries, sample description, and all
other surveys or data obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover, and/or completion
operations, will be filed with Form 3160-4. When requested, samples (cuttings and1or samples)
will be submitted to the BLM Moab Field
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VentinqlFlarinq of Gas- Gas produced from this well may not be vented/flared beyond an initial,
authorized test period of 30 days or 50 MMcf,whichever first occurs, without the prior, written
approval of the BLM Moab Field Office. Should gas be vented or flared without approval beyond
the authorized test period, the well may be ordered to be shut-in untilthe gas can be captured or
until approval to continue the venting/flaring pursuant to NTL-4A is granted. Compensation shall
be due for gas that is vented/flared without approval.

Produced Water- An application for approval of a permanent disposal method and location will
be submitted to the BLM Moab Field Officefor approval pursuant to Onshore Oiland Gas Order
No.7.

Off-Lease Measurement, Storage, Comminqllnq- Prior approval must be obtained from the BLM
Moab Field Office for off-lease measurement, off-lease storage and/or commingling of
production prior to the sales measurement point. The term "commingling" describes both the
combining of production from different geologic zones and/or combining production from
different leases or agreement areas.

Pluqqinq and Abandonment- If the well is a dry hole, plugging instructions must be obtained from
the BLM Moab Field Office prior to initiating plugging operations.

A "Subsequent Report of Abandonment" (Sundry Notice, Form 3160-5) will be filed withthe BLM
Moab Field Officewithinthirty-days following completion of the wellfor abandonment. This
report will indicate where plugs were placed and the current status of surface restoration. Upon
completion of approved plugging, a regulation marker will be erected in accordance with 43 CFR
3162.6. Final abandonment will not be approved until the surface reclamation work required by
the approved APD or approved abandonment notice has been completed to the satisfaction of
the Forest Service, Ferron Ranger District Office.

TABLE 1
NOTIFICATIONS

NotifyTom Lloyd (435-636-3596) of the Forest Service, Ferron Ranger District; or
Walton Willis (435-636-3662) of the BLM Price Field Office for the following:

2 days prior to commencement of dirt work, construction and reclamation; (Lloyd)

1 day prior to spud; (Willis)

50 feet prior to reaching the surface casing setting depth; (Willis)

3 hours prior to testing BOP equipment. (Willis)

Ifthe person at the above number cannot be reached, notify the BLM Moab Field Officeat
435-259-2100.

Well abandonment operations require 24-hour advance notice and prior approval. Inthe case of
newly drilled dry holes, verbal approval can be obtained from:

Eric Jones, Petroleum Engineer Office: 435-259-2117
Home:
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER
USA-U-01740

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

T UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME
Do not use this form for proposals lo drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° Clear Creek Unitdrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8 WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL D GAS WELL OTHER Ridge Runner 8-19

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc. 4301530682
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10 FIELDAND POOL. OR WILDCAT

119 S. Tennessee on McKinney TX ,.,75069 (972) 540-2967 Clear Creek Unit
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE 1514' FSL, 1736' FWL COUNTY Emery

QTRIQTR, SECTION. TOWNSHIP, RANGE. MERIDIAN: NESW 20 14S 7E STATE
UTAH

11 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION2 NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASINGREPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER 1 Year APD
CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPt.ETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Extension

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all peninentdetails including dates, depths, volumes, etc

Marion Energy Inc. is requesting a one year extension of its APD for the Ridge Runner 8-19, API Number 4301530682. We
are requestingthisbecause of theavailabilityof rigs.

Approvedby the
Utah Divisionof

Oil,Gasand Mining

NAME(PULEEASEPRINT) Scott coby TTE As2soc20ateLandman

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse
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Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(this form should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

API: 4301530682
Well Name: Ridge Runner 8-19

Location: NESW Sec 20 Tl4S R7E
Company Permit Issued to: Mid Power Resource Corporation
Date Original Permit issued: 4/26/2006

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submitted in the previously
approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface
agreement been updated? YesONom

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location? YesO Nom

Has therebeen any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the
permitting or operation of this proposed well? YesO No O

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way, which could affect the proposed location? YesO NoIZl

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? YesO Nom

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
which willrequire a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation? YesO NoO

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? YesŒNoO

4/23/2007

Signature Date

Title: Associate Lan an

Representing: Marion Energy,

Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(this form should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

API: 4301530682
Well Name: Ridge Runner 8-19

Location: NESW Sec 20 Tl4S R7E
Company Permit Issued to: Mid Power Resource Corporation
Date Original Permit issued: 4/26/2006

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submitted in the previously
approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface
agreement been updated? YesONom

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect
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4/23/2007

Signature Date

Title: Associate Lan an

Representing: Marion Energy,

Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(this form should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)
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Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? YesO Nom

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
which willrequire a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
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4/23/2007

Signature Date

Title: Associate Lan an

Representing: Marion Energy,



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER

UTU68538
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIEIENAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A
7. UNITorCA AGREEMENTNAME

Do notuse this¾rm ¾r proposals b ddli newweis, signlicanly deepen asleiry weis belour curmt bodom-hole depth, reenterplugged weMa,or a N/A
drill horizontal ialalais Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLibnn for auchpinposals.

1. TYPEOFWELL 8. WELLNAMEandNUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL GTHER Utah Federal 18-7-27-21

2. NAMEOFOPERATOR 9. API NUMBER
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QTWOTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 27 18S 7E S STATE:
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O SUBSEQUENT RM CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK MTER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOriginalFonnOnly)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS O PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) MTER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork compleion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMADONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE GTHER: OXtend APD

O CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT mRMADON

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS Clearly show all pertinert details including dates, depths, volumes, elo

XTO is requesting permission to extend the existing APD. BLMapproval was just granted on 05/22/2007.

Approvedby the
Utah Divisionof

Oil, Gas and Mining

Date:

NAME(PLEASEPRINT3 KylaVaughan Regulatory Compliance

SGNATURE omm 6/26/2007

(Tids spese for alateuse only)

RECEIVED

.2.., ......................,
JULO62001

DIVOF0lL,GAS&

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER

UTU68538
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIEIENAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A
7. UNITorCA AGREEMENTNAME

Do notuse this¾rm ¾r proposals b ddli newweis, signlicanly deepen asleiry weis belour curmt bodom-hole depth, reenterplugged weMa,or a N/A
drill horizontal ialalais Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLibnn for auchpinposals.

1. TYPEOFWELL 8. WELLNAMEandNUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL GTHER Utah Federal 18-7-27-21

2. NAMEOFOPERATOR 9. API NUMBER

XTO ENERGY INC. 4301530692
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

2700 Farmington AW. Farmington STATE NM z,87401 (505) 324-1090 FERRON SANDSTONE
4 LOCAT10NCFWELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 888' FNLx 1824' FWL couvr< EMERY

QTWOTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 27 18S 7E S STATE:
UTAH

a CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
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.2.., ......................,
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3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

2700 Farmington AW. Farmington STATE NM z,87401 (505) 324-1090 FERRON SANDSTONE
4 LOCAT10NCFWELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 888' FNLx 1824' FWL couvr< EMERY

QTWOTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 27 18S 7E S STATE:
UTAH

a CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ADDizE Dm REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATlON
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit In Dupicale) ALTER CASING FRACTURETRENT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Appumbnab adewmin"•- O CASNG MR NM CONWGRON O TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS O OPERATOR CHANGE O TUUNG REPNR

O CHANGETUMNG O PLUGAND-DON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT RM CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK MTER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOriginalFonnOnly)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS O PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) MTER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork compleion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMADONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE GTHER: OXtend APD

O CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT mRMADON

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS Clearly show all pertinert details including dates, depths, volumes, elo

XTO is requesting permission to extend the existing APD. BLMapproval was just granted on 05/22/2007.

Approvedby the
Utah Divisionof

Oil, Gas and Mining

Date:

NAME(PLEASEPRINT3 KylaVaughan Regulatory Compliance

SGNATURE omm 6/26/2007

(Tids spese for alateuse only)

RECEIVED

.2.., ......................,
JULO62001

DIVOF0lL,GAS&



Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(thisform shouldaccompanythe Sundry Notice requestingpermit extension)

Well Name: Utah Federal 18-7-27-21

Location: 888' FNL x 1824' FWL in Sec 27, TISS, R7E
Company Permit issued to: XTO Energy, Inc.
Date Original Permit issued: 7/12/2006

The undersignedas ownerwithlegal rightsto drillon the property as permitted
above, hereby veriflesthat the information as submitted in the previously
approved applicationto drill,remains validand does not require revision.

Followingis a checklistof seme items relatedte the application,whjghShquid be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownemhipchanged, ifso, has the surface
agreement been updated? YesONom

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinityof the proposed wellwhich wouldaffect
the spacing or sitingrequirementsfor this location? YesO Nom

Has therebeen anyunitorotheragreements put in place thatcouldaffect the
permitting or operationof this proposed well? YesO Nom

Have therebeen any changes to the access toute including ownership,or right-
of-way,which couldaffect the proposed location? YesO No O

Has the approved source of water for drillingchanged7 YesO NoO

Have therebeen anyphysicalchangesto the surface location or access route
whichwillrequirea change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation?YesONoO

Is bonding stillin place, whichcovers thisproposed well? Yes ŒNoO

6/29/2007

Signatu Date

Title: Regulatory Compliance

Representing: XTO Energy, Inc.

RECEIVED
JUL0 62007

Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(thisform shouldaccompanythe Sundry Notice requestingpermit extension)

Well Name: Utah Federal 18-7-27-21

Location: 888' FNL x 1824' FWL in Sec 27, TISS, R7E
Company Permit issued to: XTO Energy, Inc.
Date Original Permit issued: 7/12/2006

The undersignedas ownerwithlegal rightsto drillon the property as permitted
above, hereby veriflesthat the information as submitted in the previously
approved applicationto drill,remains validand does not require revision.

Followingis a checklistof seme items relatedte the application,whjghShquid be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownemhipchanged, ifso, has the surface
agreement been updated? YesONom

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinityof the proposed wellwhich wouldaffect
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Have therebeen any changes to the access toute including ownership,or right-
of-way,which couldaffect the proposed location? YesO No O

Has the approved source of water for drillingchanged7 YesO NoO

Have therebeen anyphysicalchangesto the surface location or access route
whichwillrequirea change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation?YesONoO

Is bonding stillin place, whichcovers thisproposed well? Yes ŒNoO

6/29/2007

Signatu Date

Title: Regulatory Compliance

Representing: XTO Energy, Inc.

RECEIVED
JUL0 62007

Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(thisform shouldaccompanythe Sundry Notice requestingpermit extension)

Well Name: Utah Federal 18-7-27-21

Location: 888' FNL x 1824' FWL in Sec 27, TISS, R7E
Company Permit issued to: XTO Energy, Inc.
Date Original Permit issued: 7/12/2006

The undersignedas ownerwithlegal rightsto drillon the property as permitted
above, hereby veriflesthat the information as submitted in the previously
approved applicationto drill,remains validand does not require revision.

Followingis a checklistof seme items relatedte the application,whjghShquid be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownemhipchanged, ifso, has the surface
agreement been updated? YesONom
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Have therebeen any changes to the access toute including ownership,or right-
of-way,which couldaffect the proposed location? YesO No O

Has the approved source of water for drillingchanged7 YesO NoO

Have therebeen anyphysicalchangesto the surface location or access route
whichwillrequirea change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation?YesONoO

Is bonding stillin place, whichcovers thisproposed well? Yes ŒNoO

6/29/2007

Signatu Date

Title: Regulatory Compliance

Representing: XTO Energy, Inc.

RECEIVED
JUL0 62007



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESGNATION ANDSERIAL NUMIBER
USA-U-01740

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTSON WELLS
& IFINOWN,AU.ONEORTRIGENAME

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME
Do notuse lefonn ¾r ¡xnimseh b dril newwalg eignMcaniy deepen exising wals below currenNx m-holedepti, reenterplugged mig or Clear Creek Unit

dril herbaritat talerab Use APPUCATION FOR PERMiT TO DRILL¾rm for sucti proposals.

1. TYPEOFWELL •- & WEU.NAMEandNUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL U OTHER Ridge Runner 8-19

2. NAMECFOPERATOft 9. APINUMBEft

Marion Energy, Inc.
3, ADDRESSOFOPERATOR: MONE NUMBER 10. 88.0 AND POOL, OR T:

1198. Tennessee etTY sTATE TX z,,75069 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat
4. LOCNDONOF WELL

FODTAGESATSURFAce 1487tt FSL 1695 ft FWL couarv Emery

GNUOTR, SECHON, TOWNSHIP, RANGE. MERIDMN: SW 19 14S 7E srxre
UTAH

m CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O -6 O MN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O WRCE OF NTBif
(Submit in Duplicata) ALTERCMG FRACIURE TREAT SDETRACK TO REPMR WELL

w..r.--- CASNG RM NEW CONSTRUCDON TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS O OWOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETM M AND MDON VENT OR FI,ARE

2 - Den - O CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK Mim DISPOSAL
(Submit Origimi Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTJREsUME) MTER SHVf-OFF

Daimer wolk compleuen:
O COMMINGLEPRODUGNGFOmmS RECLAMATIONOFWELLSITE GTHER: Move in Pete Martin

O CONVERTWWWE RECOMPLETE-DIFFERENTFORMATION

12 DESCRISEPROPOSEDOR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS. Clearlyshow allpertinent details including dates, depths, volurnes, eto

Moved in Pete Martin Drilling and set and cemented 40' of 20" conductor. This sundry willserve as spud notification on thiswell

ug Endsley TITLE VP OperatiODS

SIGNATURE DATE 8/3/2007

(Tids spans sorstateune only) RE EIVED
AUS1 O2007

to (SeelnshmUonsonnemuleSicle) DNOFOILGAS&

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESGNATION ANDSERIAL NUMIBER
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ug Endsley TITLE VP OperatiODS

SIGNATURE DATE 8/3/2007

(Tids spans sorstateune only) RE EIVED
AUS1 O2007

to (SeelnshmUonsonnemuleSicle) DNOFOILGAS&



DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: MARION ENERGY, INC

Well Name: RIDGE RUNNER 8-19

Api No: 43-015-30682 Lease Type: FEDERAL

Section 20 Township 14S Range 07E County EMERY

Drilling Contractor RIG #

SPUDDED:
Date 08/13/07

Time

How DRY

Drilling wi/I Commence:

Reported by RL TATMAN

Telephone # (801) 471-0895

Date 08/14/07 Signed

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: MARION ENERGY, INC

Well Name: RIDGE RUNNER 8-19

Api No: 43-015-30682 Lease Type: FEDERAL

Section 20 Township 14S Range 07E County EMERY

Drilling Contractor RIG #

SPUDDED:
Date 08/13/07

Time

How DRY

Drilling wi/I Commence:

Reported by RL TATMAN

Telephone # (801) 471-0895

Date 08/14/07 Signed

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: MARION ENERGY, INC

Well Name: RIDGE RUNNER 8-19

Api No: 43-015-30682 Lease Type: FEDERAL

Section 20 Township 14S Range 07E County EMERY

Drilling Contractor RIG #

SPUDDED:
Date 08/13/07

Time

How DRY

Drilling wi/I Commence:

Reported by RL TATMAN

Telephone # (801) 471-0895

Date 08/14/07 Signed



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDERGMRONANDSERML NUMBER
USA-U-01740

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS 6.FWOWN,AU.OMEORTRIGENAME

7. UNITarCAAGREEMENTNAME
Oo not use die form W pinposals ¾ áti new welk <ieepen exising weis beks ment M cleph, reenbar ¢ugged 9Neh, odo Clear Creek Unitesinadannian.aram.u..AerucanOIWORPERMR TODRILLiormforms:hproposak

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
Oit WELL Q GAS WELL OTHER Ridge Runner 8-19

2. NAMECFOPERATOR 9. APINUMBEft

Marion Energy, Inc. 30 (¶¶(og 1
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOlt PHONE NUMBER 10. FtELD ANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:

tte s.Tennessee exv McKinney , TX ,75069 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat
4. LOCATIONOFWELL

FOOFASEBATSURFACE: 1502.88 ft FSL 4719.2510 FWL COUmY: Emery

OmuFR.SECRON,TOWNSHIP,RANGE.MERIDIAN:SW20 148 7E sram
UTAH

n. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACOZE DEPEN REPERFORK CURRENT FORMADON
NOTICE OF INTENT

(aendt in Dupcale) O ALTER CASNG FRACTURE TREAT SDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Appladmale date workwill M CASNG MR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMFORARILY ABANDON

8/13/2007 Q CM TO PREYWW OPERATOR CHANGE WW -R

O e--a O MANDABANDON VENTORFLARE

O SUBSECIUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK WH WOSAL
twenitoriginalFormonly)

O CHANGEWELL STATUS MODUCRON (STARDRESUME) WM SHUT-OFF

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSTE OTHER.

O CONVŒf WELLWPE RECOMPLETE - ŒFERENT FORMKDON

u DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPL.ETEDOPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinent details inohxiingdates, depths,volurnes,elo

We propse to change our casing program on thiswell as follows:

Surface casing willbe changed from 10 3/4", J-55, 40.5#to 13 3/8", J-55, 61 #in a 17 1/2" hole set at 500' wl 502 sx, Premium
"G"cement.

Intermediate casing willbe changed from 7 5/8", J-55, 26.4# to 9 5/8", J-55, 36#in a 12 1/4"hole set at 3500' w/ 359 sx
Premium Lite as lead and 389 sx 50/50 Poz as tail.

Production casing willbe changed from 5 1/2", J-55, 17#to 7", N-80, 23#run to surface. Casing willbe set in an 8 3/4" hole to a
TD of +/-8900'. Casing willbe cemented wl 372 sx of Premium Lite as lead and 280 sx 50/50 Poz as tail.Allvolumes are
figured wi75% excess.

NAME(REASEPRINT) g Endsley vm.E VP Operations

SIGNATURE DATE 8110/2007

Accepted by the

oi as u ning
RECEIVED
AUS1 62007

on DN.0F0lL,GAS&
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Premium Lite as lead and 389 sx 50/50 Poz as tail.

Production casing willbe changed from 5 1/2", J-55, 17#to 7", N-80, 23#run to surface. Casing willbe set in an 8 3/4" hole to a
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AUS1 62007
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1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
Oit WELL Q GAS WELL OTHER Ridge Runner 8-19

2. NAMECFOPERATOR 9. APINUMBEft

Marion Energy, Inc. 30 (¶¶(og 1
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOlt PHONE NUMBER 10. FtELD ANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:

tte s.Tennessee exv McKinney , TX ,75069 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat
4. LOCATIONOFWELL

FOOFASEBATSURFACE: 1502.88 ft FSL 4719.2510 FWL COUmY: Emery

OmuFR.SECRON,TOWNSHIP,RANGE.MERIDIAN:SW20 148 7E sram
UTAH

n. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACOZE DEPEN REPERFORK CURRENT FORMADON
NOTICE OF INTENT

(aendt in Dupcale) O ALTER CASNG FRACTURE TREAT SDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Appladmale date workwill M CASNG MR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMFORARILY ABANDON

8/13/2007 Q CM TO PREYWW OPERATOR CHANGE WW -R

O e--a O MANDABANDON VENTORFLARE

O SUBSECIUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK WH WOSAL
twenitoriginalFormonly)

O CHANGEWELL STATUS MODUCRON (STARDRESUME) WM SHUT-OFF

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSTE OTHER.

O CONVŒf WELLWPE RECOMPLETE - ŒFERENT FORMKDON

u DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPL.ETEDOPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinent details inohxiingdates, depths,volurnes,elo

We propse to change our casing program on thiswell as follows:

Surface casing willbe changed from 10 3/4", J-55, 40.5#to 13 3/8", J-55, 61 #in a 17 1/2" hole set at 500' wl 502 sx, Premium
"G"cement.

Intermediate casing willbe changed from 7 5/8", J-55, 26.4# to 9 5/8", J-55, 36#in a 12 1/4"hole set at 3500' w/ 359 sx
Premium Lite as lead and 389 sx 50/50 Poz as tail.

Production casing willbe changed from 5 1/2", J-55, 17#to 7", N-80, 23#run to surface. Casing willbe set in an 8 3/4" hole to a
TD of +/-8900'. Casing willbe cemented wl 372 sx of Premium Lite as lead and 280 sx 50/50 Poz as tail.Allvolumes are
figured wi75% excess.

NAME(REASEPRINT) g Endsley vm.E VP Operations

SIGNATURE DATE 8110/2007

Accepted by the

oi as u ning
RECEIVED

AUS1 62007
on DN.0F0lL,GAS&



STATE OF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITYACTION FORM

Operator: Marion Energy Inc Operator Account Number: N 2740

Address: 119 S. Tennessee, Ste. 200

city McKinney

state TX zip 75069 Phone Number: (972) 540-2967

Well 1

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

4301530682 Ridge Runner #8-19 NESW 20 14S 7E Emery

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

A 99999 8/13/2007

Comments:

wellA2PI
Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

weilA3PI
Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

ACTION CODES:
A - Establish new entityfor newwell (singlewell only) Benjamin Evans

B - Add new well to existingentity(groupor unit well) y ((Ple Prl t)

C - Re-assign wellfrom one existingentityto another xisting entity
D - Re-assign wellfrom one existingentityto a new entity Signature /

E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) Landman i i
Title Date
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

OtÞARTMENTOFNATURALREGOURcas
DIVISIONOFOIL,GASANDMINING 5. 1.EASEDESIGNABONANDSERIN.NUMBER

USA-U-01740

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
6. OWN,ALLUREEORTRIGEMME

7. UNir er CA AGREEMEI(f NAME
Omnot use gis tonnfor propeaals & ddt - weHB, signMcanUydeepen exledngweis below cunent bommhole depts, reenior ¢ugged , or in Clear Creek Unit

drMhodzonianalama Use APPUCKHON FOR PERMIT TO DRILL¾nn for such propossa

1. TYPE OF WELL --
8. VMELLIMME arxi NUMBER:

OILWELL U GAS WELL OTHER Ridge Runner 8-19

2. NAMECFOPERATOR 9 APÏNUMBER

Marion Energy, Inc. J- o Lí-- 30£ 8,2,
3 ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10 FIELDANDPOOL, OR Vin.DCAT:

tie s. Te.nnenee crrv mney , ,,, TX 775069 {972) 540-2967 Wildcat
4 I.OCEDONOF" /519 ESL. /915' PWL

roorABESATSURFACE $$Û .88 ft FSL 1719.25 ft FWL COUNN: Emery

GNUOTR. SECTION, TOWNSHP, RANGE.MERIDIAN:SW 20 14S 7E simie
UTAH

« CHECK APPROPRIATEBOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE,REPORT,OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISGION TYPE OF ACTION

O NORCEOFNTBR
ME -N MFomcummm

> 0 m C-G FRACTURE TREAT SDETRACK TO RERR WELL

a .....--aw.- CAGNGREM NEWCONSTRUCOON TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CMTO PREV OUS OPERATOR CHANGE MG REM

O e--• O W AWDABANDON W OR M

-T O CHANGEWEU. NAME O aue-a^cm O WER DISPOSAL

($dNB1 flginal FONS Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCHON (STARTMSUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Dabefmo complemn
O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMKm RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: BÌOoie Line Ignitor

8/29/2007 O CONTWELM RECOMREFE-ŒFERENTFORMADON

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSEDOR COMPLETED OPERATIONSCleartyshow allpettinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

At the direction of the BLM field inspector the following change was made to the original drillingplan submitted withthe APD
concemingthe blooie line ignitor. The original plan called for a blooie line ignitor to be used on location. However, it is our
intention to use a bucket of diset hung at the end of the blooie line for gas detection.

RECEIVED
SEPO4 2007

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

NAME(REASE DOug Endsley VP Operations

8/29/2007
SIGNATURE A n. AVA DATE

(This space for shte use only)

(araloo) (see instrucionson Reverse

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

OtÞARTMENTOFNATURALREGOURcas
DIVISIONOFOIL,GASANDMINING 5. 1.EASEDESIGNABONANDSERIN.NUMBER

USA-U-01740

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
6. OWN,ALLUREEORTRIGEMME

7. UNir er CA AGREEMEI(f NAME
Omnot use gis tonnfor propeaals & ddt - weHB, signMcanUydeepen exledngweis below cunent bommhole depts, reenior ¢ugged , or in Clear Creek Unit

drMhodzonianalama Use APPUCKHON FOR PERMIT TO DRILL¾nn for such propossa

1. TYPE OF WELL --
8. VMELLIMME arxi NUMBER:

OILWELL U GAS WELL OTHER Ridge Runner 8-19

2. NAMECFOPERATOR 9 APÏNUMBER

Marion Energy, Inc. J- o Lí-- 30£ 8,2,
3 ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10 FIELDANDPOOL, OR Vin.DCAT:

tie s. Te.nnenee crrv mney , ,,, TX 775069 {972) 540-2967 Wildcat
4 I.OCEDONOF" /519 ESL. /915' PWL

roorABESATSURFACE $$Û .88 ft FSL 1719.25 ft FWL COUNN: Emery

GNUOTR. SECTION, TOWNSHP, RANGE.MERIDIAN:SW 20 14S 7E simie
UTAH

« CHECK APPROPRIATEBOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE,REPORT,OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISGION TYPE OF ACTION

O NORCEOFNTBR
ME -N MFomcummm

> 0 m C-G FRACTURE TREAT SDETRACK TO RERR WELL

a .....--aw.- CAGNGREM NEWCONSTRUCOON TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CMTO PREV OUS OPERATOR CHANGE MG REM

O e--• O W AWDABANDON W OR M

-T O CHANGEWEU. NAME O aue-a^cm O WER DISPOSAL

($dNB1 flginal FONS Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCHON (STARTMSUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Dabefmo complemn
O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMKm RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: BÌOoie Line Ignitor

8/29/2007 O CONTWELM RECOMREFE-ŒFERENTFORMADON

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSEDOR COMPLETED OPERATIONSCleartyshow allpettinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

At the direction of the BLM field inspector the following change was made to the original drillingplan submitted withthe APD
concemingthe blooie line ignitor. The original plan called for a blooie line ignitor to be used on location. However, it is our
intention to use a bucket of diset hung at the end of the blooie line for gas detection.

RECEIVED
SEPO4 2007

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

NAME(REASE DOug Endsley VP Operations

8/29/2007
SIGNATURE A n. AVA DATE

(This space for shte use only)

(araloo) (see instrucionson Reverse

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

OtÞARTMENTOFNATURALREGOURcas
DIVISIONOFOIL,GASANDMINING 5. 1.EASEDESIGNABONANDSERIN.NUMBER

USA-U-01740

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
6. OWN,ALLUREEORTRIGEMME

7. UNir er CA AGREEMEI(f NAME
Omnot use gis tonnfor propeaals & ddt - weHB, signMcanUydeepen exledngweis below cunent bommhole depts, reenior ¢ugged , or in Clear Creek Unit

drMhodzonianalama Use APPUCKHON FOR PERMIT TO DRILL¾nn for such propossa

1. TYPE OF WELL --
8. VMELLIMME arxi NUMBER:

OILWELL U GAS WELL OTHER Ridge Runner 8-19

2. NAMECFOPERATOR 9 APÏNUMBER

Marion Energy, Inc. J- o Lí-- 30£ 8,2,
3 ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10 FIELDANDPOOL, OR Vin.DCAT:

tie s. Te.nnenee crrv mney , ,,, TX 775069 {972) 540-2967 Wildcat
4 I.OCEDONOF" /519 ESL. /915' PWL

roorABESATSURFACE $$Û .88 ft FSL 1719.25 ft FWL COUNN: Emery

GNUOTR. SECTION, TOWNSHP, RANGE.MERIDIAN:SW 20 14S 7E simie
UTAH

« CHECK APPROPRIATEBOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE,REPORT,OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISGION TYPE OF ACTION

O NORCEOFNTBR
ME -N MFomcummm

> 0 m C-G FRACTURE TREAT SDETRACK TO RERR WELL

a .....--aw.- CAGNGREM NEWCONSTRUCOON TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CMTO PREV OUS OPERATOR CHANGE MG REM

O e--• O W AWDABANDON W OR M

-T O CHANGEWEU. NAME O aue-a^cm O WER DISPOSAL

($dNB1 flginal FONS Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCHON (STARTMSUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Dabefmo complemn
O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMKm RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: BÌOoie Line Ignitor

8/29/2007 O CONTWELM RECOMREFE-ŒFERENTFORMADON

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSEDOR COMPLETED OPERATIONSCleartyshow allpettinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

At the direction of the BLM field inspector the following change was made to the original drillingplan submitted withthe APD
concemingthe blooie line ignitor. The original plan called for a blooie line ignitor to be used on location. However, it is our
intention to use a bucket of diset hung at the end of the blooie line for gas detection.

RECEIVED
SEPO4 2007

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

NAME(REASE DOug Endsley VP Operations

8/29/2007
SIGNATURE A n. AVA DATE

(This space for shte use only)

(araloo) (see instrucionson Reverse



RECEIVED
Marion Energy inc. SEPO4 2007

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

LSEE MNE &WRL NO. RED û¾FE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Gear Creak August 30, 2007
RIGMME MID NUMBER COUNTY SiATE DAf NO.

UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Emery Utah 28
rØiMLDEPfH Ret. His cumRat. His FOOTAGEDRILLED CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET© Rqxxt No.

3915' 0 143 0 9 5/8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 28
AcnvnYAf REPORTEME REPORTEDBY

Un-pluggingdrill string/ Jars. )R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
REMARES

KBTOGL

There was icm left over in th( drill string from before the casing run that plugged off thebha / Jars plugged. 15
TIME LOG

mon to nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 Lay down casing slips and spider, change elevators, install test plugin stack to test BOPE, function test

9:00 3.00 pipeand blind rams, chance o rings in koomey hoses.

9:00 Test BOPE as follows: Test Pipe rams and choke line as well as bottom flange on stack to 250 low and

3000 psi high for 30 minutes. Function test remote on rig floor puffplupand test casing to 250 psi towfor 5

12:30 3.50 minutes then 900 psi for 30 minutes. Tested By Double jacktestingof Vemal Utah.

12:30 13:30 1.00 Rig repairs/ Well controi equipment.
13:30 15:00 1.50 pickup mandrel assembly and break out with rig tongs.
15:00 Pick up bit and directional toolsscribe tools and start in hole, laydown 6" drill collars and unplug them then

22:00 7.00 pickthem back up and go in hole. Trip in hole to 1270'

22:00 1:00 3.00 Change Kellyout with new one.

1:00 2:00 1.00 Install rotating head.
2:00 3:00 1.00 Try to pumpthroughstring to blow out casing drill string plugged.
3:00 6:00 3.00 Pull out of hole to unplug drill string.

Total I oum 24.00 FUEL ANDWATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 1.00 FUEL USED 540 Gallons Boiler Hours NA P

Hrs. Mob./Demot 0,00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 740 In 0 Out OWN

fGTALDAYWORI¢ 23.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 29330 Barrels E

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSi ISED BIT RECOFD

DEFm 3886' NO. OF SACKS/tBS PRODUCTNAME STf NO, 4

TIME 9:00 4 Poly plus SI2E 8 3/4

WE[GHT 8.4 25 Fed Seal MFG Smith

vis 27 AL.Starate TYPE M516LKHPX

wt NC 40 sawoust TFA 1.63

PvjyP 6 Fed-Zan JET 3x20/2x18/2x13

MET 70 CS Hulls SERIALNo. ER20095

CA 15 21 KwikPlug DEPTHOUT

GEts Duragel DEPTHIN 3915'

ALK 0.0/0.2 Asphasol TOTALFEET Û

pH 7 Max Gel Hns 0.00

CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G

CL 1,300 DAILYCOST $4,283.00 WT. ON BIT

DAPP tr PREVIOUSCOST RPM

%sot10s tr CUMULATIVECOST $24,956.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLINGASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA MEVIATIONREC)RD

NO. DESCMPTION i.ENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Incinadom / Azimuth

1 BIT 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 2949' 35.9/295.20

1 MOTOR 23.25 MODEL 8P80 SPSO 3034' 38.70/296.80

1 PONYNMDC 10.00 smOME 8.50 8.50 3137
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RECElVED
Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste SEPO4 2007
McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

URSENAM&WRLNO. HED Om

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 29, 2007
RIGIMMEMID NUMBER COUNTY STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 27
IOTALDEPHI Rot Hrs cuinRet.His POCTAGEORD.LED I.ASTCASINGSIZE,WBGHT, GRADE SETO Report Na

3915' O 143 0 9 5/8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 27
AcnvnYAf REPORTTME REPORTEDBY

NippleUp BOPE |R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
REMRBS

KBTO a.
15

TIME l.OG
¯

mces to nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 11:00 5.00 Runing 9 518"casing from 1576' to 3880' tag up tagup on soit fill with 7,000 (set down wt)
11:00 13:00 2.00 Rip up circulatingswedge, and fill pipe,break circulation (no retums with 193 ppm)workpipe
13:00 14:30 1.50 Try to wash down casing Wash down 6' work pipeup and stuck pipeat 3880'
14·30 Work stuck casing pickup as much as 275 K, slack off on Pipe and tumto right with rig tongs 5 rounds,

17:30 3.00 work up and down while tryingto circulate1200 psiwith rig pumpsat 1/2 bpm.then uped rate to 7 bpm

17:30 20:00 2.50 rig up cementers and pumpon pipewith cement truck@ 1500 psi broke free and worked pipeup and down.

20:00 22:00 2.00 Pump Cement work casing up and down throughout (ob pumped cement as per below

22:00 23:00 1.00 Rig down casers and cementers.
23:00 2:00 3.00 Nipple down SOP choke Killand flowline / Pick up stack and set slips With 145,000 puttedon casing

2:00 2:30 0.50 Cut off casing at weit head level I lay down 16.86' cut off,

2:30 4:00 1.50 Cut casing offto 3" obove slips I set secondary seal assembly, set stack down.

4:00 6:00 2.00 Nipple up BOPE, Choke, Kill,and flowlines,
Shoe set at 3890.61'RKB / Float set at 3847.44' RKB

Cement Specifications: Lead Slurry: 490sx with 16% get, 3% salt, 3 #/sx GR3, 1/4 sx flocele, 10#Isx

Gilsonite g 11 ppgwith a yelldof 3.82
Tail slurry : 450 sx 50/50 poz10%sait Bwow,1/4 #/sx flocele @ 14.2 pppwith a yeid of 1.62

Pumped 600 bbis ahead with some retums, no retums during jobBumped plugwith 450 psi over circulating
pressureof 750 psi. Plug down at : 21:35

Total I ours 24.00 FUEL AND WATERUSE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 540 Galtons Boiler Hours NA UP

Hrs. Mob./Demot 0.00 abis.Water hauled last 24 hours 90 In 0 Out DOWN

TOTALDAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O used on well & road 28590 Barrels ROTATE
MUD (ECORD MUD MATERIALSl ISED BIf IEC0F D

DEPTH 3886' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BTFNO. 3

TIME 9:00 Poly plus SIZE 12 1/4

WEIGHT 8.4 Fed Seal MFG JZ

VIs 27 AL.Simals TYPE HAT517GC

WL NC sawDust 3ET Open

PVlYP Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT CS Huis SERIALNo. E09682

CA 15 KwikPlug DEPTHouT 3915'

GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 2766'

Auc 0.0/0.2 Asphasof TOTAL.FEET 1149

pH 7 MaxGet NRS 61.00

CAKE Cotten seed hulls TIB/G 3,8,

CL 1,300 DAILYCOST WT.ON BrT 35-45k

DAPP ti PREVIOUSCOST RPM 55-90

%Souns tr cuMULAT1vEcosT $20,673.00 RDP(fph) 18.8
DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD

ND. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inraman..m / Azanande

MAIŒ Nat Nat 2949' 35.9/295.20

MODEL 8P80 8P80 3034' 38.70/296.80

STROKE 8.50 8.50 3137

RECElVED
Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste SEPO4 2007
McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

URSENAM&WRLNO. HED Om

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 29, 2007
RIGIMMEMID NUMBER COUNTY STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 27
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RECEIVEDMarion Energy inc.
119 s Tennessee, ste SEPO4 2007

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT DIV.0F0lL,GAS&MINING

URSE RME &WEU. NO. RED DME

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak August 28, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUWiY 5TATE DAYNO.

Unit DriningCorp. Rig 132 Emert Utah 26
(UTÆDEPfH Rd. Hrs cumRd. His FOGTAGEDRIGED UST CASUGSŒ, WSGHT, GRADE SETO Report a

3915' 5.5 148.5 75 13-3/8" 54.5 J-55 540 RBK 26
ACTIVHYAr REPORTTfME REPORTEDBY

Running casing R.L.Tatman / Shiloh Williams
REMAMS

KBTO .

15
ÏIME LO3

m0M TO HOUns ACTIVITYDETAIL
6:00 11:30 5.50 Directional drilling 12 1/4" hole withAiriatedwater from 3840' to 3915"

11:30 14:00 2.50 Circulate hole pumpLcm Sweeps around I fillhole.

14:00 17:00 3.00 Pull out of hole for logs
17:00 19:00 2.00 Lay down Directionaltoolsand 8" assembly.
19•00 22:00 3.00 Log weli Run GR,CN,CDL,DIL,Caliper,Loqqs went to bottom without problems/Loggers TD = 3915'

22:00 6:00 8.00 Rig Up Casers and run 9 5/8" to 1576'

Totai Gouw 24.00 FUELANDWATERUSI I BOILER HOURS STRINGWT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP

Hm. Mob./Demolt 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 90 In 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H20 used on well &road 28590 Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSI1SED BIT RECOI D

DEFTH 3886' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 3

TIME 9:00 8 Poly plus SIZE 12 1/4

WEIGIT 8.4 35 Fed Seal MFG .lZ

VIs 27 1 AL Sterate TYPE HAT517GC

WL NC 45 Saw Dust 3ET Open

PVlYP Fed-zan 3ET Open

MEff CS Huffs SERIALNo. E09682

cA 15 20 KwikPlug DEPTHotiT 3915'

GELS 60 Duragel DEPTHIN 2766'

ALK 0.0/0.2 Asphasol TOTALFEET 1149

pH 7 5 MaxGet HRS 61.00

CAKE 30 Cotton seed hulls T/BJG 3,8,

CL 1,3ÛÛ DAILYCOST $3,321.00 WT.ON Brr 35-45k

DAPP ti PREVIOUSCOST RPM 55-90

%soLIDS tr CUMULATIVECOST $20,673.00 ROP(fph) 18.8

DRILLING ASSE SBLY PUMP f ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD

tio. DESCINFFION LENGm - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFm IncBneUen / Azmuth

MAKE Nat Nat 2949' 35.9/295.20

NODEL SPSO 8PSO 3034' 38,70/296.80
smOME 8.50 8.50 3137 41.90/298
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 3230'
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RECEIVED
Marion Energy inC' SEPO4 2007

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069 DIV.OFOlL,GAS&MINING

DAILYDRILLINGREPORT
LEMEMMEaWELNO. RED DŒ

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 27, 2007
MG MME MD NUMBR COUWY STR DAYNO.

UnitDrillingCo . Rig 132 Emely Utah 25
(UTALDERN Rd. M ann antM TOUTAGEDMUED LASTCA5mG SIZE,Waan, MDE SET@ , Repod &

3840' 23.5 143 j 607' 13-3/8" 54.5 3-55 540 RBK 25
envny «r REPORTME REPORTEDBY

Directionalwork | Drilling 12 1/4" hole IR.LTatman | Shiloh Williams
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

mon To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:00 6.00 Directional drilling 12 1/4" hole with Alriated water from 3233' to 3412'

12:00 12:30 4.50 Lubricate Rig
12:30 6:00 17.50 Directional drilling 12 1/4" hole with Airiated water from 3412' to 3840'

ToimiMours 24,00 FUELANDWATERUSL I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 798 Galtons Boiler Hours NA UP 125,000

Hrs. Mob.fDemot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 400 in 0 Out OWN 105,000

TOTALÐAYWORi¢ 24.00 Total H2O m ad on we11& road 28500 Barrels TATE 80,000

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALS ISED BIT RECOTD

DEPTH 3623' NO. OF SACKS/I.BS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 3
TIME 8:30 78 Dopp SIZE 12 1/4

WEIGir 8.4 Fed Seal MN 3Z

vis 27 Ai..Sterate TYPE HAT517GC

WL NC SawDust 3ET Open

Pv/YP Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT CS Hulls SERIALNo. E09682

CA 15 KwikPlug DEPTHOUT

GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 2766'

ALK 0.0/0.2 Asphaeol TOTALFEET 1074'

pH 7 MaxGel HRs 55.50

CAKE C325 T/B/G

CL 1,300 DAILYCOST $2,372.00 WT. ON MT 35-45k

DAPP tr PREVIOUSCOST RPM 55-90

%SOLIDS tr CUMULATIVECOST $17,352.00 ROP(fph) 19.3

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP i ATA DEVIATIÓNREC )RD

NO. DESCIUPflON LENGHi- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFHi Inclination / Azmuth

1 12.25 1.53 MAIŒ Nat Nat 2949' 35.9/295.20

1 FI.Mtr 27.99 MoDEL SPSO SP80 3034' 38.70/296.80

1 Shock sub 10.60 smOKE 8.50 8.50 3137 41.90/298

1 Pony NMDC 10.27 1.INER SIZE 6.25 6.25 3230'
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UnitDrillingCo . Rig 132 Emely Utah 25
(UTALDERN Rd. M ann antM TOUTAGEDMUED LASTCA5mG SIZE,Waan, MDE SET@ , Repod &

3840' 23.5 143 j 607' 13-3/8" 54.5 3-55 540 RBK 25
envny «r REPORTME REPORTEDBY

Directionalwork | Drilling 12 1/4" hole IR.LTatman | Shiloh Williams
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

mon To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:00 6.00 Directional drilling 12 1/4" hole with Alriated water from 3233' to 3412'

12:00 12:30 4.50 Lubricate Rig
12:30 6:00 17.50 Directional drilling 12 1/4" hole with Airiated water from 3412' to 3840'

ToimiMours 24,00 FUELANDWATERUSL I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 798 Galtons Boiler Hours NA UP 125,000

Hrs. Mob.fDemot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 400 in 0 Out OWN 105,000

TOTALÐAYWORi¢ 24.00 Total H2O m ad on we11& road 28500 Barrels TATE 80,000

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALS ISED BIT RECOTD

DEPTH 3623' NO. OF SACKS/I.BS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 3
TIME 8:30 78 Dopp SIZE 12 1/4

WEIGir 8.4 Fed Seal MN 3Z

vis 27 Ai..Sterate TYPE HAT517GC

WL NC SawDust 3ET Open

Pv/YP Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT CS Hulls SERIALNo. E09682

CA 15 KwikPlug DEPTHOUT

GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 2766'

ALK 0.0/0.2 Asphaeol TOTALFEET 1074'

pH 7 MaxGel HRs 55.50

CAKE C325 T/B/G

CL 1,300 DAILYCOST $2,372.00 WT. ON MT 35-45k

DAPP tr PREVIOUSCOST RPM 55-90

%SOLIDS tr CUMULATIVECOST $17,352.00 ROP(fph) 19.3

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP i ATA DEVIATIÓNREC )RD

NO. DESCIUPflON LENGHi- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFHi Inclination / Azmuth

1 12.25 1.53 MAIŒ Nat Nat 2949' 35.9/295.20

1 FI.Mtr 27.99 MoDEL SPSO SP80 3034' 38.70/296.80

1 Shock sub 10.60 smOKE 8.50 8.50 3137 41.90/298

1 Pony NMDC 10.27 1.INER SIZE 6.25 6.25 3230'



Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste SEPO4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
ŒASEMME &WEL NO. RED DKrE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 26, 2007
RIGMNE MID NUMBER UUNTY STATE DAYNO.

UnitDrilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 24
TOTM.OEPf¾ Rat. Ms aan Ret. His FOOTAGEORIGED UST CASUS SIZE,WBGHT, GRADE SETO Report a

3233' 21.5 141 445' |13-3/8"54.5 J-55 540 RBK 24
ACTIVHYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Directional work| Drilling 12 1/4" hole R.LTatman | Shiloh Williams
REManus RniShed buld sectionrotatin/ drillingtangent surveyingevery90' wero a.

15 jts 95/8" casingdelivered to location By Bunning tras. Icleaned, drifted and tallyedby Rig crew 15
TIME LOG

mm To uouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:30 0.50 Pump lost primeI Clean out suction screen I NOT Rig Repair

6:30 8:00 1.50 Change out Rotating head rubber.
8:00 13:00 5.00 Directional drilling 12 1/4" hole with Airiatedwater from 2788' to 2945'

13:00 13:30 0.50 Lubricate Rig
13:30 6:00 16.50 Directional drilling 12 1/4" hole with Ailiated water from 2945' To 3233'

TotaWours 24,00 FUELANDWATERUSEI BOILER HOURS ( STRINGWT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 570 Gallons Boller Hours NA UP 116,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 360 In 0 Out DOWN 90,000
TOTALDAYWORR 24.00 Total H2O m ed on well & road 28100 Barrels 98,000

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALSf ISED 81T RECOF D

DEFTH 2889 NO. OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNO. 3

TIME 12:00 Depp SIZE 12 1/4
WEIGHT 8.4 Fed Seal MFG JZ

VIs 28 AL.Sterate TYPE HAT517GC

WL NC sawDust ler Open

PVlYP Fed-Zan 3ET Open

MET CS Hulls SERIALNo. E09682

CA 15 KwikPlug DEFTHOUT

GELS Durage! DEPTHIN 2766'

ALK 0.0/0.2 Asphasol TOTALFEEr 467

pH 7 MaxGet HRS 22.00

CAKE C325 T/B/G

CL 1,200 DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 35-45k

DAPP tr PREVIOUSCO5T RPM 55-90

%souns tr CUMULATIVECOET $14,980.00 ROP(fph) 22.0
DRILLINGASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD

No. DESCRIPTION l.ENGFH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPIH Incinadon / Azmath

1 12.25 1.53 MAKE Nat Nat 2112 17.7/281.4

1 M,Mtr 27.99 MoDEL SP80 SPSO 2205 19.4/283.5

1 Shock sub 10.60 smOKE 8.50 8.50 2300 21.3/285.10

1 Pony NMDC 10.27 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 2393

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste SEPO4 2007

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
ŒASEMME &WEL NO. RED DKrE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 26, 2007
RIGMNE MID NUMBER UUNTY STATE DAYNO.

UnitDrilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 24
TOTM.OEPf¾ Rat. Ms aan Ret. His FOOTAGEORIGED UST CASUS SIZE,WBGHT, GRADE SETO Report a

3233' 21.5 141 445' |13-3/8"54.5 J-55 540 RBK 24
ACTIVHYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Directional work| Drilling 12 1/4" hole R.LTatman | Shiloh Williams
REManus RniShed buld sectionrotatin/ drillingtangent surveyingevery90' wero a.

15 jts 95/8" casingdelivered to location By Bunning tras. Icleaned, drifted and tallyedby Rig crew 15
TIME LOG

mm To uouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:30 0.50 Pump lost primeI Clean out suction screen I NOT Rig Repair

6:30 8:00 1.50 Change out Rotating head rubber.
8:00 13:00 5.00 Directional drilling 12 1/4" hole with Airiatedwater from 2788' to 2945'

13:00 13:30 0.50 Lubricate Rig
13:30 6:00 16.50 Directional drilling 12 1/4" hole with Ailiated water from 2945' To 3233'

TotaWours 24,00 FUELANDWATERUSEI BOILER HOURS ( STRINGWT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 570 Gallons Boller Hours NA UP 116,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 360 In 0 Out DOWN 90,000
TOTALDAYWORR 24.00 Total H2O m ed on well & road 28100 Barrels 98,000

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALSf ISED 81T RECOF D

DEFTH 2889 NO. OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNO. 3

TIME 12:00 Depp SIZE 12 1/4
WEIGHT 8.4 Fed Seal MFG JZ

VIs 28 AL.Sterate TYPE HAT517GC

WL NC sawDust ler Open

PVlYP Fed-Zan 3ET Open

MET CS Hulls SERIALNo. E09682

CA 15 KwikPlug DEFTHOUT

GELS Durage! DEPTHIN 2766'

ALK 0.0/0.2 Asphasol TOTALFEEr 467

pH 7 MaxGet HRS 22.00

CAKE C325 T/B/G

CL 1,200 DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 35-45k

DAPP tr PREVIOUSCO5T RPM 55-90

%souns tr CUMULATIVECOET $14,980.00 ROP(fph) 22.0
DRILLINGASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD

No. DESCRIPTION l.ENGFH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPIH Incinadon / Azmath

1 12.25 1.53 MAKE Nat Nat 2112 17.7/281.4

1 M,Mtr 27.99 MoDEL SP80 SPSO 2205 19.4/283.5

1 Shock sub 10.60 smOKE 8.50 8.50 2300 21.3/285.10

1 Pony NMDC 10.27 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 2393

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste SEPO4 2007

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
ŒASEMME &WEL NO. RED DKrE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 26, 2007
RIGMNE MID NUMBER UUNTY STATE DAYNO.

UnitDrilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 24
TOTM.OEPf¾ Rat. Ms aan Ret. His FOOTAGEORIGED UST CASUS SIZE,WBGHT, GRADE SETO Report a

3233' 21.5 141 445' |13-3/8"54.5 J-55 540 RBK 24
ACTIVHYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Directional work| Drilling 12 1/4" hole R.LTatman | Shiloh Williams
REManus RniShed buld sectionrotatin/ drillingtangent surveyingevery90' wero a.

15 jts 95/8" casingdelivered to location By Bunning tras. Icleaned, drifted and tallyedby Rig crew 15
TIME LOG

mm To uouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:30 0.50 Pump lost primeI Clean out suction screen I NOT Rig Repair

6:30 8:00 1.50 Change out Rotating head rubber.
8:00 13:00 5.00 Directional drilling 12 1/4" hole with Airiatedwater from 2788' to 2945'

13:00 13:30 0.50 Lubricate Rig
13:30 6:00 16.50 Directional drilling 12 1/4" hole with Ailiated water from 2945' To 3233'

TotaWours 24,00 FUELANDWATERUSEI BOILER HOURS ( STRINGWT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 570 Gallons Boller Hours NA UP 116,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 360 In 0 Out DOWN 90,000
TOTALDAYWORR 24.00 Total H2O m ed on well & road 28100 Barrels 98,000

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALSf ISED 81T RECOF D

DEFTH 2889 NO. OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNO. 3

TIME 12:00 Depp SIZE 12 1/4
WEIGHT 8.4 Fed Seal MFG JZ

VIs 28 AL.Sterate TYPE HAT517GC

WL NC sawDust ler Open

PVlYP Fed-Zan 3ET Open

MET CS Hulls SERIALNo. E09682

CA 15 KwikPlug DEFTHOUT

GELS Durage! DEPTHIN 2766'

ALK 0.0/0.2 Asphasol TOTALFEEr 467

pH 7 MaxGet HRS 22.00

CAKE C325 T/B/G

CL 1,200 DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 35-45k

DAPP tr PREVIOUSCO5T RPM 55-90

%souns tr CUMULATIVECOET $14,980.00 ROP(fph) 22.0
DRILLINGASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD

No. DESCRIPTION l.ENGFH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPIH Incinadon / Azmath

1 12.25 1.53 MAKE Nat Nat 2112 17.7/281.4

1 M,Mtr 27.99 MoDEL SP80 SPSO 2205 19.4/283.5

1 Shock sub 10.60 smOKE 8.50 8.50 2300 21.3/285.10

1 Pony NMDC 10.27 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 2393



RECEIVEDMarionEnergy inc.
119 s Tennessee, ste SEPOit 2007

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT DIV.0F0lL,GAS&MINING

URNAM&WEU.NŒ RED DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 25, 2007
MG NME MD NUMBER COUNTY STATE MY NO.

UnitDrillinqcorp.Rig 132 Emery Utah 23
iCIAL DOW Rot Mis aan Rd. Hrs FOGTME DRIRED MST CASING812E,WBGHT, GRADE SETO Report &

2788' \ 0.5 | 119.5 22' |13-3/8"54.5 J-55 540 RBK 23
ACilvHYMREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Direchonal work| Drilling 12 1/4" hole R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
REMARMS KBTOGL.

80 Jts9 5/8" casing deliveret' to location By Bunning tras.I cleaned, drifted and tallyedby Circle D Services. 15
TIME LOG

m054 10 HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:30 2.50 Brake out bit and Motor, Lay down Mud motor, Pick up new motor and Make up bit.
8:30 9:00 0.50 Scribe directional tools.
9:00 11:00 2.00 Directional drilling 12 1/4" hole with Airiated water from 2482' to 2766'
11:00 11:30 0.50 Directional / Test EM tool/ toolfailed to come on andoperate.
11:30 12:30 1.00 Pull out of hole for Directional tools.
12:30 22:00 9.50 Try to repairtools,Wait on tools,Nevis energy did not have the componantson location to repair tool.
22:00 23:00 1.00 Pick up new EM tooland scribe the same.
23:00 1:00 2.00 Trip in hole to 1720'
1:00 2:00 LOO Install rotating head, Test directional tools.
2:00 3:00 1.00 Trip in hole to 2720'
3:00 5:30 2.50 Wash 60' to bottom aprox 20' of hard fill. Tryto get hole to circulate consistantly with1800cfm & 190gpm

3:00 6:00 0.50 Directional drilling 12 1/4" hole withAiriated water from 2766" to 2788'

Total Uours 24.00 FUEL ANDWATERUS i I BOILER HOURS STRINGWT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 570 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 112,000
drs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 360 in O DOWN 88,000
FOTALDAYWORÞ 24.00 Total waler us xi on well to date 7 Barrets ROTATE 96,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALLUSED BIT RECOFD

DEFm 2766 No.0F SACK5/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNo. 2 3
TIME 23:00 Dapp SIZE 12 1/4 12 1/4
WElair 8.4 Fed Seal MFG Reed JZ
VIs 28 AL.Sterate TYPE M4249DH HAT517GC
WL NC Saw Dust JET open Open

PVfYP 5 Fed-Zan JET Open Open
MBT CS Hulls SERIALNo. LD6464 E09682

CA 15 KwikPlug DEVfHOut 2766
GELS Duragel DEFU IN 540 2766'
ALK 0.0/0.2 Asphasol TOTALFEET 2316' 22

pH 7 45 MaxGet HRs 80 0.50

CAKE C325 T/B/G 3,5,fc,a,e,1,ct,dtf

cL 8ÛÛ DAILYCOST $2,311.00 WT. ON Brr 35-40 K 18-35K

DAPP tr PREVIOUSCOET RPM 55/90 55-90

%SOLIDS tr CUMULATIVECOST $17,291,00 ROP(fph) 28.9 44.0
DRILLING ASSE WBLY PUMP JATA I-EVIATION REC3RD

NO, DESCRIPTION i.ENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm IncHnation / Azmuth

1 12.25 1.53 MAKE Nat Nat 1923 14.7/278.6

1 M.Mtr 27.99 MODEL 8PSO 8P80 2017 16.70/279.5

1 Shock sub 10.60 SROKE 8.50 8.50 2112 17.7/281.4

1 Pony NMDC 10.27 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25 2205

RECEIVEDMarionEnergy inc.
119 s Tennessee, ste SEPOit 2007

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT DIV.0F0lL,GAS&MINING

URNAM&WEU.NŒ RED DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 25, 2007
MG NME MD NUMBER COUNTY STATE MY NO.

UnitDrillinqcorp.Rig 132 Emery Utah 23
iCIAL DOW Rot Mis aan Rd. Hrs FOGTME DRIRED MST CASING812E,WBGHT, GRADE SETO Report &

2788' \ 0.5 | 119.5 22' |13-3/8"54.5 J-55 540 RBK 23
ACilvHYMREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Direchonal work| Drilling 12 1/4" hole R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
REMARMS KBTOGL.

80 Jts9 5/8" casing deliveret' to location By Bunning tras.I cleaned, drifted and tallyedby Circle D Services. 15
TIME LOG

m054 10 HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:30 2.50 Brake out bit and Motor, Lay down Mud motor, Pick up new motor and Make up bit.
8:30 9:00 0.50 Scribe directional tools.
9:00 11:00 2.00 Directional drilling 12 1/4" hole with Airiated water from 2482' to 2766'
11:00 11:30 0.50 Directional / Test EM tool/ toolfailed to come on andoperate.
11:30 12:30 1.00 Pull out of hole for Directional tools.
12:30 22:00 9.50 Try to repairtools,Wait on tools,Nevis energy did not have the componantson location to repair tool.
22:00 23:00 1.00 Pick up new EM tooland scribe the same.
23:00 1:00 2.00 Trip in hole to 1720'
1:00 2:00 LOO Install rotating head, Test directional tools.
2:00 3:00 1.00 Trip in hole to 2720'
3:00 5:30 2.50 Wash 60' to bottom aprox 20' of hard fill. Tryto get hole to circulate consistantly with1800cfm & 190gpm

3:00 6:00 0.50 Directional drilling 12 1/4" hole withAiriated water from 2766" to 2788'

Total Uours 24.00 FUEL ANDWATERUS i I BOILER HOURS STRINGWT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 570 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 112,000
drs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 360 in O DOWN 88,000
FOTALDAYWORÞ 24.00 Total waler us xi on well to date 7 Barrets ROTATE 96,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALLUSED BIT RECOFD

DEFm 2766 No.0F SACK5/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNo. 2 3
TIME 23:00 Dapp SIZE 12 1/4 12 1/4
WElair 8.4 Fed Seal MFG Reed JZ
VIs 28 AL.Sterate TYPE M4249DH HAT517GC
WL NC Saw Dust JET open Open

PVfYP 5 Fed-Zan JET Open Open
MBT CS Hulls SERIALNo. LD6464 E09682

CA 15 KwikPlug DEVfHOut 2766
GELS Duragel DEFU IN 540 2766'
ALK 0.0/0.2 Asphasol TOTALFEET 2316' 22

pH 7 45 MaxGet HRs 80 0.50

CAKE C325 T/B/G 3,5,fc,a,e,1,ct,dtf

cL 8ÛÛ DAILYCOST $2,311.00 WT. ON Brr 35-40 K 18-35K

DAPP tr PREVIOUSCOET RPM 55/90 55-90

%SOLIDS tr CUMULATIVECOST $17,291,00 ROP(fph) 28.9 44.0
DRILLING ASSE WBLY PUMP JATA I-EVIATION REC3RD

NO, DESCRIPTION i.ENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm IncHnation / Azmuth

1 12.25 1.53 MAKE Nat Nat 1923 14.7/278.6

1 M.Mtr 27.99 MODEL 8PSO 8P80 2017 16.70/279.5

1 Shock sub 10.60 SROKE 8.50 8.50 2112 17.7/281.4

1 Pony NMDC 10.27 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25 2205

RECEIVEDMarionEnergy inc.
119 s Tennessee, ste SEPOit 2007

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT DIV.0F0lL,GAS&MINING

URNAM&WEU.NŒ RED DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 25, 2007
MG NME MD NUMBER COUNTY STATE MY NO.

UnitDrillinqcorp.Rig 132 Emery Utah 23
iCIAL DOW Rot Mis aan Rd. Hrs FOGTME DRIRED MST CASING812E,WBGHT, GRADE SETO Report &

2788' \ 0.5 | 119.5 22' |13-3/8"54.5 J-55 540 RBK 23
ACilvHYMREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Direchonal work| Drilling 12 1/4" hole R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
REMARMS KBTOGL.

80 Jts9 5/8" casing deliveret' to location By Bunning tras.I cleaned, drifted and tallyedby Circle D Services. 15
TIME LOG

m054 10 HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:30 2.50 Brake out bit and Motor, Lay down Mud motor, Pick up new motor and Make up bit.
8:30 9:00 0.50 Scribe directional tools.
9:00 11:00 2.00 Directional drilling 12 1/4" hole with Airiated water from 2482' to 2766'
11:00 11:30 0.50 Directional / Test EM tool/ toolfailed to come on andoperate.
11:30 12:30 1.00 Pull out of hole for Directional tools.
12:30 22:00 9.50 Try to repairtools,Wait on tools,Nevis energy did not have the componantson location to repair tool.
22:00 23:00 1.00 Pick up new EM tooland scribe the same.
23:00 1:00 2.00 Trip in hole to 1720'
1:00 2:00 LOO Install rotating head, Test directional tools.
2:00 3:00 1.00 Trip in hole to 2720'
3:00 5:30 2.50 Wash 60' to bottom aprox 20' of hard fill. Tryto get hole to circulate consistantly with1800cfm & 190gpm

3:00 6:00 0.50 Directional drilling 12 1/4" hole withAiriated water from 2766" to 2788'

Total Uours 24.00 FUEL ANDWATERUS i I BOILER HOURS STRINGWT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 570 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 112,000
drs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 360 in O DOWN 88,000
FOTALDAYWORÞ 24.00 Total waler us xi on well to date 7 Barrets ROTATE 96,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALLUSED BIT RECOFD

DEFm 2766 No.0F SACK5/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNo. 2 3
TIME 23:00 Dapp SIZE 12 1/4 12 1/4
WElair 8.4 Fed Seal MFG Reed JZ
VIs 28 AL.Sterate TYPE M4249DH HAT517GC
WL NC Saw Dust JET open Open

PVfYP 5 Fed-Zan JET Open Open
MBT CS Hulls SERIALNo. LD6464 E09682

CA 15 KwikPlug DEVfHOut 2766
GELS Duragel DEFU IN 540 2766'
ALK 0.0/0.2 Asphasol TOTALFEET 2316' 22

pH 7 45 MaxGet HRs 80 0.50

CAKE C325 T/B/G 3,5,fc,a,e,1,ct,dtf

cL 8ÛÛ DAILYCOST $2,311.00 WT. ON Brr 35-40 K 18-35K

DAPP tr PREVIOUSCOET RPM 55/90 55-90

%SOLIDS tr CUMULATIVECOST $17,291,00 ROP(fph) 28.9 44.0
DRILLING ASSE WBLY PUMP JATA I-EVIATION REC3RD

NO, DESCRIPTION i.ENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm IncHnation / Azmuth

1 12.25 1.53 MAKE Nat Nat 1923 14.7/278.6

1 M.Mtr 27.99 MODEL 8PSO 8P80 2017 16.70/279.5

1 Shock sub 10.60 SROKE 8.50 8.50 2112 17.7/281.4

1 Pony NMDC 10.27 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25 2205



Marion Energy inc. RECElVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069 SEPO4 2007

DAn.Y DRILLING REPORT DIV.OF00 , GAS&MINING
LEASEMMIE&WEU.ND. fmD DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 24, 2007
RIGMANEMIDNUMBER OMHY STATE CAYND.

UnitDrilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 22
RNEDEPTH At. Ma Amt.As fDDTAGE DMUÆD CASE SIZE,WBGHT, GRADE SETO Reimat No.

2766' j 20 119 466' 13-3/8" 54.5 J-55 540RBK 22
ACIIVRTATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Directional work| Drilling12 1/4" hole R.LTatman | ShilohWilliams
REMARIS KBTOGL

\ 15
TIME LOG

moM TO HOuns Activity Detail
6:00 12:00 6.00 Directionaldrilling12 1/4" hole withAiriated water from 2296' io 2482'
12·00 12:30 0.50 Lubricate rig.
12'30 2:30 14.00 DirectionaldriHing 12 1/4" hole withAiristed water from 2482' to 2766'
2:30 6:00 3.50 Pull out of hole for Bitand mud moinr.

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED IIT RECORD

DEPm 2410 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 2 3

7WE 9:00 Dapp SIZE 12 1/4 12 1/4

WEIGur 8.34 Fed Seal MFG Reed JZ

vis 30 AL.Sterate TYPE M4249DH HAT517GC

WL NC Saw Dust JET Opên Open

PV/YP 2 Fed-Zan SERIALNo. LD6464 E09682

MST CS Hulls DEPN OtTT 2766

CA 40 KwikPlug DEPm m 540 2766'

GELS Duragel TOTALFEET 2316'

AI.x 0.0/0.8 Asphasol Has 80 0.00

pH 7 10 Max Get TIB/G 3,5,fe,a,e,1,ct,dif

CAKE C325 WT. ON Brr 35-40 K

CL 1,200 DAILYCOST $1,200.00 RPM 55)90

DAPP 0.000 PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph) 28.9
%souns 1% CUMULARVECOST $14,980.00 ANVEL dc 277.0

DRILLING ASSE 48LY PUMP D ITA DEVIATION RECORD

NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Ammuth

i 12.25 1.53 MAKE Nat Nat 1923 14.7/278.6

1 M.Mtr 27.99 MODEL SPSO SPSO 2017 16.70/279.5

1 Shock sub 10.60 STROKE 8.50 8.50 2112 17.7/281.4

1 Pony NMDC 10.27 LINERSIzE 6.25 6.25 2205 19.4/283.5

1 NMDC 30.09 SPM 60 2300 21.3/285.10

1 Gap Sub 3.95 GPM 193.00 2393 22.9/286.6
1 NMDC 30.10 sunF Passsuas 600.0 2485 25.30/287.4

1 XOSub 237 ECD 2576' 28.4/287.5

6 6" DrißCollars 184.03 SLOWPUMP-SPN O O 2668' 30.1/289.1

9 HWDP 276.64 staW PuMP- PRES Û Û 276Û /
1 Jars 29.72 AIR DrBBng Operadons data Daly wei cost $50,017
21 4-1/2" HWDP 641.96 scFM 1800 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $693,250

U:\Pacogxxtts.xts BHA 1249.25 ImEcrioN RATE 15 CuMutATivE WELLCOST

Marion Energy inc. RECElVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069 SEPO4 2007

DAn.Y DRILLING REPORT DIV.OF00 , GAS&MINING
LEASEMMIE&WEU.ND. fmD DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 24, 2007
RIGMANEMIDNUMBER OMHY STATE CAYND.

UnitDrilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 22
RNEDEPTH At. Ma Amt.As fDDTAGE DMUÆD CASE SIZE,WBGHT, GRADE SETO Reimat No.

2766' j 20 119 466' 13-3/8" 54.5 J-55 540RBK 22
ACIIVRTATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Directional work| Drilling12 1/4" hole R.LTatman | ShilohWilliams
REMARIS KBTOGL

\ 15
TIME LOG

moM TO HOuns Activity Detail
6:00 12:00 6.00 Directionaldrilling12 1/4" hole withAiriated water from 2296' io 2482'
12·00 12:30 0.50 Lubricate rig.
12'30 2:30 14.00 DirectionaldriHing 12 1/4" hole withAiristed water from 2482' to 2766'
2:30 6:00 3.50 Pull out of hole for Bitand mud moinr.

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED IIT RECORD

DEPm 2410 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 2 3

7WE 9:00 Dapp SIZE 12 1/4 12 1/4

WEIGur 8.34 Fed Seal MFG Reed JZ

vis 30 AL.Sterate TYPE M4249DH HAT517GC

WL NC Saw Dust JET Opên Open

PV/YP 2 Fed-Zan SERIALNo. LD6464 E09682

MST CS Hulls DEPN OtTT 2766

CA 40 KwikPlug DEPm m 540 2766'

GELS Duragel TOTALFEET 2316'

AI.x 0.0/0.8 Asphasol Has 80 0.00

pH 7 10 Max Get TIB/G 3,5,fe,a,e,1,ct,dif

CAKE C325 WT. ON Brr 35-40 K

CL 1,200 DAILYCOST $1,200.00 RPM 55)90

DAPP 0.000 PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph) 28.9
%souns 1% CUMULARVECOST $14,980.00 ANVEL dc 277.0

DRILLING ASSE 48LY PUMP D ITA DEVIATION RECORD

NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Ammuth

i 12.25 1.53 MAKE Nat Nat 1923 14.7/278.6

1 M.Mtr 27.99 MODEL SPSO SPSO 2017 16.70/279.5

1 Shock sub 10.60 STROKE 8.50 8.50 2112 17.7/281.4

1 Pony NMDC 10.27 LINERSIzE 6.25 6.25 2205 19.4/283.5

1 NMDC 30.09 SPM 60 2300 21.3/285.10

1 Gap Sub 3.95 GPM 193.00 2393 22.9/286.6
1 NMDC 30.10 sunF Passsuas 600.0 2485 25.30/287.4

1 XOSub 237 ECD 2576' 28.4/287.5

6 6" DrißCollars 184.03 SLOWPUMP-SPN O O 2668' 30.1/289.1

9 HWDP 276.64 staW PuMP- PRES Û Û 276Û /
1 Jars 29.72 AIR DrBBng Operadons data Daly wei cost $50,017
21 4-1/2" HWDP 641.96 scFM 1800 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $693,250
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U:\Pacogxxtts.xts BHA 1249.25 ImEcrioN RATE 15 CuMutATivE WELLCOST



· - RECEIVEDManon Energy inc.
ne s Tennessee, ste SEPO4 2007

McKinney, Texas 75069

DW.0F0lL,GAS&MINING
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

ISSE MME&Wm NO. FIRD DE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clearcreak August 23, 2007
RIGNME ANDNUMBER COUIHY STATE DAY#0.

Unit Drilli . 132 Emery Utah 21
Tora nwrN M Ms a as muTAGEORRWO GSHIG 512E,WEtc,NT, MADE SET9 Rigart No.

2300 21 99 536 13-3/8" 54.5 J-55 540RBK 21
ACTIVHY Ar REPORTTDig REPORTEDBY

Directional Drilling C.E. Cow/ R. M. Crow
RENRIS KBTOGL.

SmaiOi Show g 1830' Per Mudingper 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO HOUns Activity Detail
6:00 7:30 1.50 Slips Stuck in The Rolary Tablet Bent Joint Of DrinPipe Lay DownJoint & Replace in String
7:30 Sliding/1764'-1784'I DrinActuall 1784'-17967 Sliding/1796'-1816't Dril Actual/ 1816'-1829'

13:00 5.50 II 1829'-185TTSlidingi185T-18TTIDrii Actual/ 1877-1888'

13:00 13·30 0.50 Rig Service
13:30 14:30 1.00 Work On Air Package Booster

S 1908'-19207 Sliding!1920'-1940Y Drii Actual/ 1940'-1950'
Actuall 1970'-19827Sliding/1982'-20027 DriuActuall 2002'-2012'

Sliding/2012'-2022'l Dril Actuall 2022'-2043'I Sliding/2043'-2063'lDrii Actual/ 2063' 2075'

Sliding/2075'-2095'I Drii Actuali 2095'-2108"I Sliding!210B'-2128Y DritiActual/ 2128'-2139'
S WHActual/ 2164'-2171Y Sliding/ 2171'-2196'/ DrillActual/ 2196'-2203'

2228'-22347 Sliding/2234'-22597 Drii Actual/2259'-22687
6:00 15.50 etuall 2291'-2296YSliding/ 2296'-2300'

24,00
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIAf S USED RIT RECORD

DEPTH 1472 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME Brf NO. 2
E 17:00 Depp SIZE 12 1/4
GHT 3.6 Fed Seal MFG Reed

vis 34 AL. Sterate TWE M4249DH
& NC sawoust ,ier open
PV/YP 3/2 Fed-Zan SERIAi.No. LD6464

MBT CS Hulls DEPU OUT 2300

CA 10 NWikPlug DEVmDI 540
GELS 0/1 16 Duragel TOTALFEET 1224

ALK .0|.15
Asphasol HRS 60

pH 7 20 Max Get T/B/G

CAKE 2 C325 WT. ONBIT 25-28K

CL 3ÛÛ DAILYCOET $1,200.00 RPM 55/90
OAPP 2,ÛÛO PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph) 21.8
%souns 2 CUMULATIVECOST $12,580.00 ANVEL

DRIt.LENGASSE 4BLY PUMP D 4TA DEVI GION RFTORD

Na DESCRIPflON LENGTH - FF PUMPNO. 1 2 DEPfH INCf.lNATION / Azmuth

1 12.25 1.53 MAKE Nat Nat 1737 11.6/274.7

1 M.Mtr 27.99 MODEL SPSD SPSD 1829 13/278.20

1 Shock sub 10.60 srROKE 8.50 8.50 1923 14.7/278.6

1 Pony NMDC 10.27 UNERSIZE 6.25 6.25 2017 16.70/279.5

1 NMDC 30.09 SPN 85 2112 17.7/281.4

1 Gap Sub 3.95 GPM 287.00 2205 19.4/283.5

1 NMDC 30.10 SURF PRESSURE 0.0
1 XO Sub 2.37 ECD

6 6" Drli Conars 184.03 SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
9 HWDP 276.64 SWW PUMP- PRES Û Û
1 Jars 29.72 AIR Drilling Operations data DAILYWELLCOST $45,295

21 4-1/2" HWDÞ 641.96 scFM 1800 PREVIOUSCUMcorr $671,055
u:\Pnoo\oonts.ns BHA 1249.25 IN3ECTION RATE 25 CUMUIATIVEWELLWST
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MarionEnergy inc. RECElVED
",*|a&*9 SEPO4 2007

DAILY ORIU.ING REPORT DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING
UMMAME&WEU.NO. BRD DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 ClearCreak August 22, 2007
RIGNAMENO IKMBER COUNTY STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emesy Utah 20
vorn new not.a. notum FODTAGEORRED ¿AST CASING512E, WBGHi, GRADE SETO Rigm No.

1764 | 19 78 610 13-3/8N 54.5 J-55 540RBK 20
acrrmva swear vmE REPORTED6Y

Drill Actual C.E. Crow/ R. M.Crow
REMMS KBTOGl.

15
TIME LCl

MON TO HOURs Activity Detail
6:00 8:30 2.50 Mud Up To 3840 Vis
8:30 12:30 4.00 Drii Actuali 1154'-1326'
12 3D 13:00 0.50 Rig AirCompressor Down Over Heating
1390 16:00 3.00 Slidingi1326'-13367 DrillActual/ 1336'-1420YSliding/1420'-1430'

16:00 16:30 0.50 Rig AirCompressor Down Over Heating
16:30 Dril Actual/ 1430'-1451'I Sliding1451'-1449'lDrii Actual/ 1459'-1481'/Sliding/ 148t'-1491'

20:00 3.50 Drii Actuall 1491'-1513'I Sliding/1513'-1522'I Drii Actual/ 1522'-1545'
20•00 21:30 1.50 Lost Returns/ Went To injecting 4gal Hour Soap & Brought AirUp To 1800cfm Mud Pump idifing

21:30 Drii Actualf 1545'-1577I Sliding 1577'-1592'I Drii Actual/ 1592'-16D7'ISliding/1607'-1620'

DriuActual/ 1620'-163TI Sliding/16371652'I DrinActual/ 1652'-1669'I Sliding/ 1669'-1684'

DridActual/ 1684'-1701'l Sidingt 1701'-1716'I DrinActual/ 1716'-1733'I Siding/ 1733'-1748'

6:00 8.50 DrinActuall 1748'-1764'

24.00
MUD lECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED BITRECORD

DEPTH 1472 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME Bir NO. 2
TIME 17:00 200 Dapp SIZE 12 1/4
WEIGHT 8.6 60 Fed Seal MFG Reed

vis 34 5 AL Sterate TYPE M4249DH

wt NC so sawone aer open
PV/YP 3/2 20 Fed-Zan SEPJALNo. LD6464

MBT 50 CS Huis DEPTHOUT 1764

CA 10 20 KWikPlug DEFTHIN 540

GELS O 1 Duragel TOTALFEET 1224

ALK .0/.15
Asphasoi Has 37.5

pH 7 82 Max Get Tis/G

CAWE 2 C325 WT. ON BIT 25-28K

CL 300 DA1LYCOST $12,580.00 RPM 55/90

DAPP 2.000 PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph) 32.6
%souns 2 CUMULATIVECOST $12,580.00 ANVEL

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP D ITA DEVIATION RECORD

NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION/ Azmuth

i 1125 1.53 MAKE Nat Nat 1172 2.8/274.10

i M.Mtr 27.99 MODEL SPSD SPSO 1267 3.9/273.0

1 Shock sub 10.60 STROKE 8.50 8.50 1361 5.1/268.0

1 Pony NMDC 10.27 11NERSIZE 6.25 6.25 1453 6.7/266.10

1 NMDC 30.09 SPM 55 1548 8.4/266.20

1 Gap Sub 3.95 ePM 187.00 1642 9.9/270.8

1 NMDC 30.10 sURF PRESSURE 0.0
1 XO Sub 137 ECD

6 6" DrillCollars 184.03 SLOW PUMP• SPM 0 0
9 HWDP 276.64 SLOW PUMP- PRES O O
1 Jars 29.72 AIR Drilling Operations data DAILYWELLcosT $55,600

21 4-1/2" HWDP 641.96 scm 1800 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $615,456
U:\PROD)OR&G.XLS BHA 1249.25 IlUECTION RATE 25 CUMULARVE WELLcosi

MarionEnergy inc. RECElVED
",*|a&*9 SEPO4 2007

DAILY ORIU.ING REPORT DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING
UMMAME&WEU.NO. BRD DATE
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GELS O 1 Duragel TOTALFEET 1224

ALK .0/.15
Asphasoi Has 37.5

pH 7 82 Max Get Tis/G

CAWE 2 C325 WT. ON BIT 25-28K

CL 300 DA1LYCOST $12,580.00 RPM 55/90
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1 Shock sub 10.60 STROKE 8.50 8.50 1361 5.1/268.0

1 Pony NMDC 10.27 11NERSIZE 6.25 6.25 1453 6.7/266.10

1 NMDC 30.09 SPM 55 1548 8.4/266.20

1 Gap Sub 3.95 ePM 187.00 1642 9.9/270.8

1 NMDC 30.10 sURF PRESSURE 0.0
1 XO Sub 137 ECD

6 6" DrillCollars 184.03 SLOW PUMP• SPM 0 0
9 HWDP 276.64 SLOW PUMP- PRES O O
1 Jars 29.72 AIR Drilling Operations data DAILYWELLcosT $55,600

21 4-1/2" HWDP 641.96 scm 1800 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $615,456
U:\PROD)OR&G.XLS BHA 1249.25 IlUECTION RATE 25 CUMULARVE WELLcosi

MarionEnergy inc. RECElVED
",*|a&*9 SEPO4 2007

DAILY ORIU.ING REPORT DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING
UMMAME&WEU.NO. BRD DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 ClearCreak August 22, 2007
RIGNAMENO IKMBER COUNTY STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emesy Utah 20
vorn new not.a. notum FODTAGEORRED ¿AST CASING512E, WBGHi, GRADE SETO Rigm No.

1764 | 19 78 610 13-3/8N 54.5 J-55 540RBK 20
acrrmva swear vmE REPORTED6Y

Drill Actual C.E. Crow/ R. M.Crow
REMMS KBTOGl.

15
TIME LCl

MON TO HOURs Activity Detail
6:00 8:30 2.50 Mud Up To 3840 Vis
8:30 12:30 4.00 Drii Actuali 1154'-1326'
12 3D 13:00 0.50 Rig AirCompressor Down Over Heating
1390 16:00 3.00 Slidingi1326'-13367 DrillActual/ 1336'-1420YSliding/1420'-1430'

16:00 16:30 0.50 Rig AirCompressor Down Over Heating
16:30 Dril Actual/ 1430'-1451'I Sliding1451'-1449'lDrii Actual/ 1459'-1481'/Sliding/ 148t'-1491'

20:00 3.50 Drii Actuall 1491'-1513'I Sliding/1513'-1522'I Drii Actual/ 1522'-1545'
20•00 21:30 1.50 Lost Returns/ Went To injecting 4gal Hour Soap & Brought AirUp To 1800cfm Mud Pump idifing

21:30 Drii Actualf 1545'-1577I Sliding 1577'-1592'I Drii Actual/ 1592'-16D7'ISliding/1607'-1620'

DriuActual/ 1620'-163TI Sliding/16371652'I DrinActual/ 1652'-1669'I Sliding/ 1669'-1684'

DridActual/ 1684'-1701'l Sidingt 1701'-1716'I DrinActual/ 1716'-1733'I Siding/ 1733'-1748'

6:00 8.50 DrinActuall 1748'-1764'

24.00
MUD lECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED BITRECORD

DEPTH 1472 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME Bir NO. 2

TIME 17:00 200 Dapp SIZE 12 1/4

WEIGHT 8.6 60 Fed Seal MFG Reed

vis 34 5 AL Sterate TYPE M4249DH

wt NC so sawone aer open
PV/YP 3/2 20 Fed-Zan SEPJALNo. LD6464

MBT 50 CS Huis DEPTHOUT 1764

CA 10 20 KWikPlug DEFTHIN 540

GELS O 1 Duragel TOTALFEET 1224

ALK .0/.15
Asphasoi Has 37.5

pH 7 82 Max Get Tis/G

CAWE 2 C325 WT. ON BIT 25-28K

CL 300 DA1LYCOST $12,580.00 RPM 55/90

DAPP 2.000 PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph) 32.6
%souns 2 CUMULATIVECOST $12,580.00 ANVEL

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP D ITA DEVIATION RECORD

NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION/ Azmuth

i 1125 1.53 MAKE Nat Nat 1172 2.8/274.10

i M.Mtr 27.99 MODEL SPSD SPSO 1267 3.9/273.0

1 Shock sub 10.60 STROKE 8.50 8.50 1361 5.1/268.0

1 Pony NMDC 10.27 11NERSIZE 6.25 6.25 1453 6.7/266.10

1 NMDC 30.09 SPM 55 1548 8.4/266.20

1 Gap Sub 3.95 ePM 187.00 1642 9.9/270.8

1 NMDC 30.10 sURF PRESSURE 0.0
1 XO Sub 137 ECD

6 6" DrillCollars 184.03 SLOW PUMP• SPM 0 0
9 HWDP 276.64 SLOW PUMP- PRES O O
1 Jars 29.72 AIR Drilling Operations data DAILYWELLcosT $55,600

21 4-1/2" HWDP 641.96 scm 1800 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $615,456
U:\PROD)OR&G.XLS BHA 1249.25 IlUECTION RATE 25 CUMULARVE WELLcosi



Marion Energy inc, RECEIVED

ÄcËn"nÙeiiŠ9 SEPO4 2007

UMWERWEU.m

DAILY DRILt.ING REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak August 21, 2007
MGNEMDRMBR UUm sm¾ DAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 19
TUTÆÐEWN RMs aas FOUTMEDERED MSTCAS-GSIZE,WEIGH,¾DE SETO RepstNo.

1154 20.5 59 ¡ 61 13-3/8N 54.5 3-55 540RBK 19
ACTIVHYATREIORT TNE REPORIEDBY

BuildingVolume |C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
numans KaTo a.

LostRelums MixMud To HoVLCM 15
TIME I.Cli

FROM TO HOUns Activity Detail
6:00 7:00 1.00 Dir.Work Trouble Shoot Dir.Tools
7:00 8:00 1.00 Circ Hole Clean & HoldSafety Meeting
8 OD 10:30 2.50 TOOH For Dir.Toolsl Top Of Mud Mtr.Washed/ O-Ring Out On MWD Tool
10:30 14:30 4.00 PU Mud Mtrl MU Bit/ Change Out Gap Sub & MWD Tool

14:30 15:00 0.50 Rig Repair/ Fix Break Out Une
15:00 17:30 2.50 TlH11nstallRot Head Rubberl KellyUp
17:30 18:00 0.50 Break Cire With Areated Fluids
18:00 18:30 0.50 Wash &Ream 1077-1093'

18:30 21:00 2.50 DrillActuali ROT 10934109'/ Sliding1109'-1124'I ROT 1124'-1154'
21:00 22:30 1.50 Leak On FlowLineGoing To Gas Buster/ Switch To Pumps &600 CFM No Retums/ Out Of Vol.
22:30 2:00 3.50 BuildVol/Att Circ. WI Pumps &Areated Fluid &600CFM No Returns
2:00 3:30 1.50 Weld On Leak On Gas Buster
3:30 4:00 0.50 Unload Hole
4:00 6:00 2.00 Buit Vol & Mix MudTo Hold LCM& Gel Plug

24.00
MUD lECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED B1TRECORD

DEPHI NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 2
TIME Dapp 512E 12 1/4
WEIGIT pac-UL MFa Reed

vis Pac-R TYPE M4249DH

WL Poly+ 3ET Open

PV/YP Fed-Zan SERIALNO. LD6464
MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT 1164
CA Myadde DEPHI IN 540
GELS Duragel TOTALFEET 604
ALX Asphasol HRS 17.5
pH Max Get T/B/G

cAKE C325 WT. ON BIT 15K
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM 55/90
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph) 31.0
%SOUDS CUMULATIVEWST $0.00 ANVEL

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP O LTA DEVIATION REI:ORD
NG. DESCRIPilON 1.ENGTH - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Aamuth

1 12.25 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 1081 2.2/265.70
i M.Mtr 28.23 900DEL SPSO SPSO
1 Shock sub 10.60 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 NMDC 10.27 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25
2 Gap Sub 3.95 SPN

1 NMDC 30.10 GPM 0.00
6 6" DrillCollars 184.03 SURF PRESSURE 0.0
9 HWDP 276.64 ECD

1 Jars 29.72 SLOWPUMP- SPM 0 0
17 4-1/2" HWDP 519.36 smW PUMP- PRES Û Û

AIR Ddling Operations data DAILYWELLCOST $42,665
scm 1200 PREVIOUSCUMcosT $572,791

R\PR ORLG.XLs BHA 1094.40 IN3ECFION RATE O CUMULATIVEWELI.COST

Marion Energy inc, RECEIVED

ÄcËn"nÙeiiŠ9 SEPO4 2007

UMWERWEU.m

DAILY DRILt.ING REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak August 21, 2007
MGNEMDRMBR UUm sm¾ DAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 19
TUTÆÐEWN RMs aas FOUTMEDERED MSTCAS-GSIZE,WEIGH,¾DE SETO RepstNo.

1154 20.5 59 ¡ 61 13-3/8N 54.5 3-55 540RBK 19
ACTIVHYATREIORT TNE REPORIEDBY

BuildingVolume |C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
numans KaTo a.

LostRelums MixMud To HoVLCM 15
TIME I.Cli

FROM TO HOUns Activity Detail
6:00 7:00 1.00 Dir.Work Trouble Shoot Dir.Tools
7:00 8:00 1.00 Circ Hole Clean & HoldSafety Meeting
8 OD 10:30 2.50 TOOH For Dir.Toolsl Top Of Mud Mtr.Washed/ O-Ring Out On MWD Tool
10:30 14:30 4.00 PU Mud Mtrl MU Bit/ Change Out Gap Sub & MWD Tool

14:30 15:00 0.50 Rig Repair/ Fix Break Out Une
15:00 17:30 2.50 TlH11nstallRot Head Rubberl KellyUp
17:30 18:00 0.50 Break Cire With Areated Fluids
18:00 18:30 0.50 Wash &Ream 1077-1093'

18:30 21:00 2.50 DrillActuali ROT 10934109'/ Sliding1109'-1124'I ROT 1124'-1154'
21:00 22:30 1.50 Leak On FlowLineGoing To Gas Buster/ Switch To Pumps &600 CFM No Retums/ Out Of Vol.

22:30 2:00 3.50 BuildVol/Att Circ. WI Pumps &Areated Fluid &600CFM No Returns
2:00 3:30 1.50 Weld On Leak On Gas Buster
3:30 4:00 0.50 Unload Hole
4:00 6:00 2.00 Buit Vol & Mix MudTo Hold LCM& Gel Plug

24.00
MUD lECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED B1TRECORD

DEPHI NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 2
TIME Dapp 512E 12 1/4
WEIGIT pac-UL MFa Reed

vis Pac-R TYPE M4249DH

WL Poly+ 3ET Open

PV/YP Fed-Zan SERIALNO. LD6464

MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT 1164

CA Myadde DEPHI IN 540

GELS Duragel TOTALFEET 604
ALX Asphasol HRS 17.5

pH Max Get T/B/G

cAKE C325 WT. ON BIT 15K

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM 55/90
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph) 31.0
%SOUDS CUMULATIVEWST $0.00 ANVEL

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP O LTA DEVIATION REI:ORD
NG. DESCRIPilON 1.ENGTH - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Aamuth

1 12.25 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 1081 2.2/265.70

i M.Mtr 28.23 900DEL SPSO SPSO
1 Shock sub 10.60 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 NMDC 10.27 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25
2 Gap Sub 3.95 SPN

1 NMDC 30.10 GPM 0.00
6 6" DrillCollars 184.03 SURF PRESSURE 0.0
9 HWDP 276.64 ECD

1 Jars 29.72 SLOWPUMP- SPM 0 0
17 4-1/2" HWDP 519.36 smW PUMP- PRES Û Û

AIR Ddling Operations data DAILYWELLCOST $42,665
scm 1200 PREVIOUSCUMcosT $572,791

R\PR ORLG.XLs BHA 1094.40 IN3ECFION RATE O CUMULATIVEWELI.COST

Marion Energy inc, RECEIVED

ÄcËn"nÙeiiŠ9 SEPO4 2007

UMWERWEU.m

DAILY DRILt.ING REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak August 21, 2007
MGNEMDRMBR UUm sm¾ DAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 19
TUTÆÐEWN RMs aas FOUTMEDERED MSTCAS-GSIZE,WEIGH,¾DE SETO RepstNo.

1154 20.5 59 ¡ 61 13-3/8N 54.5 3-55 540RBK 19
ACTIVHYATREIORT TNE REPORIEDBY

BuildingVolume |C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
numans KaTo a.

LostRelums MixMud To HoVLCM 15
TIME I.Cli

FROM TO HOUns Activity Detail
6:00 7:00 1.00 Dir.Work Trouble Shoot Dir.Tools
7:00 8:00 1.00 Circ Hole Clean & HoldSafety Meeting
8 OD 10:30 2.50 TOOH For Dir.Toolsl Top Of Mud Mtr.Washed/ O-Ring Out On MWD Tool
10:30 14:30 4.00 PU Mud Mtrl MU Bit/ Change Out Gap Sub & MWD Tool

14:30 15:00 0.50 Rig Repair/ Fix Break Out Une
15:00 17:30 2.50 TlH11nstallRot Head Rubberl KellyUp
17:30 18:00 0.50 Break Cire With Areated Fluids
18:00 18:30 0.50 Wash &Ream 1077-1093'

18:30 21:00 2.50 DrillActuali ROT 10934109'/ Sliding1109'-1124'I ROT 1124'-1154'
21:00 22:30 1.50 Leak On FlowLineGoing To Gas Buster/ Switch To Pumps &600 CFM No Retums/ Out Of Vol.

22:30 2:00 3.50 BuildVol/Att Circ. WI Pumps &Areated Fluid &600CFM No Returns
2:00 3:30 1.50 Weld On Leak On Gas Buster
3:30 4:00 0.50 Unload Hole
4:00 6:00 2.00 Buit Vol & Mix MudTo Hold LCM& Gel Plug

24.00
MUD lECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED B1TRECORD

DEPHI NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 2
TIME Dapp 512E 12 1/4
WEIGIT pac-UL MFa Reed

vis Pac-R TYPE M4249DH

WL Poly+ 3ET Open

PV/YP Fed-Zan SERIALNO. LD6464

MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT 1164

CA Myadde DEPHI IN 540

GELS Duragel TOTALFEET 604
ALX Asphasol HRS 17.5

pH Max Get T/B/G

cAKE C325 WT. ON BIT 15K

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM 55/90
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph) 31.0
%SOUDS CUMULATIVEWST $0.00 ANVEL

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP O LTA DEVIATION REI:ORD
NG. DESCRIPilON 1.ENGTH - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Aamuth

1 12.25 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 1081 2.2/265.70

i M.Mtr 28.23 900DEL SPSO SPSO
1 Shock sub 10.60 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 NMDC 10.27 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25
2 Gap Sub 3.95 SPN

1 NMDC 30.10 GPM 0.00
6 6" DrillCollars 184.03 SURF PRESSURE 0.0
9 HWDP 276.64 ECD

1 Jars 29.72 SLOWPUMP- SPM 0 0
17 4-1/2" HWDP 519.36 smW PUMP- PRES Û Û

AIR Ddling Operations data DAILYWELLCOST $42,665
scm 1200 PREVIOUSCUMcosT $572,791

R\PR ORLG.XLs BHA 1094.40 IN3ECFION RATE O CUMULATIVEWELI.COST



Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, * SEPO4McKinney,Texas 75069 2ÛÛ7

DAKY Opu a rNs REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
U¾E ME &WEU.NO. HRD OR

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 20, 2007
MGME ANDNUMBER COUNEP 6TATE CAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emesy Utah 18
MHROBRM Rat.Hm Rotas NOTAGEDMum LASTON G5EE,WEREN,GMDE SETO aqurtNo.

540' \ 17.5 56 543 13-3/8" 54.5 J-55 540RBK 18
¾ilVHYM REPORTTIME REPORIEDBY

DrillActual jC.E.Crow/ R. M.Crow
REMAMS O TOŒ.

Formation Gave g 8.8ppg He'd g 8.6ppg 15
TIME LO3

FROM TO MOUns Activity Detaii
6•00 6:30 0.50 LD3-Jts HWDP
6:30 8:00 1.50 Rig Repairi FixRotating Head Not NippledUp Correctly
8¾ 9:00 1.00 DrillFloat Equipment
9:oo 9:30 0.50 osinActuar 540'-559'
9·30 10:00 0.50 RU Testers For FIT Test
10·00 11:30 1.50 FIT Test {FormationGave gl8.8ppgHeld g|S.6ppg)((8.6-8.34)*(.052)*(540))=7.3psi

11:30 18:00 6.50 DrillActuaW599'-774'
18:00 18:30 0.50 FixLeak in Flow Line
18:30 19'00 0.50 DrillActuall774'-794'
1990 19:30 0.50 Work On Desilter Pump
19:30 23:00 3.50 DriiActuaW794'-894'
23:00 23:30 0.50 Work On Mist Pump Valves
23·30 6:00 6.50 DrillActual/ 894'-1079'I Sliding 1079'-1093'

24.00
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED RIT RECORD

DEPHI NO. OF SACK5/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 2
TwiE ospp SIZE 12 1/4

WEIGHT pac-UL MFG Reed

VIS Pad TYPE M4249DH

wt poly+ .wr open
PV/YP Bed-Zan SEIRALNo. LD6464

MET C-325 DEPTHotrr 1093

CA MyacMe DEPTHIN 540

GES Duragel TOTALFEET 543
ALK Asphasol Has 17.5
pH Max Gel T/8/G

CAME C325 WT. ON err 15K

CL DAR.YCOET $0.00 RPM 55g
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph) 31.0
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL

DRIt.LING ASSE 4BLY PUMP D ITA DEVIATION REDDRD

NCL DESCRIPTION LENGTH - PT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm INCUNATION J Aanmth

1 12.25 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 593 0.6/269.4

1 M.Mtr 28.23 MonEL 8PSO 8PSD 714 0.8/268

1 Shock sub 10.60 STROKE 8.50 8.50 805 1.10/258.8

1 NMDC 10.27 LINERSIzE 6.25 6.25 897 1.40/259.3

2 Gap Sub 3.95 sPM 0 989 1.6/261.5

1 NMDC 30.10 GPN 0.00
6 6' DrillCollars 184.03 SURF PRESSURE 0.0
9 HWDP 276.64 ECD

1 Jars 29.72 SLOW PUMP•SPN O 0
15 +1/2" HWDP 458.02 SLOW PUMP- PRES Û Û

AIR Drilling Operadens data DAILYWEU. UST $54,541
scFM 1200 PREVIOUSCUMcosT $518,250

U:VROU DRAG.XLS BHA 1033.06 IEECTION RATE 28 GPM CUMULATIVEWEu.cost

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, * SEPO4McKinney,Texas 75069 2ÛÛ7

DAKY Opu a rNs REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
U¾E ME &WEU.NO. HRD OR

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 20, 2007
MGME ANDNUMBER COUNEP 6TATE CAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emesy Utah 18
MHROBRM Rat.Hm Rotas NOTAGEDMum LASTON G5EE,WEREN,GMDE SETO aqurtNo.

540' \ 17.5 56 543 13-3/8" 54.5 J-55 540RBK 18
¾ilVHYM REPORTTIME REPORIEDBY

DrillActual jC.E.Crow/ R. M.Crow
REMAMS O TOŒ.

Formation Gave g 8.8ppg He'd g 8.6ppg 15
TIME LO3

FROM TO MOUns Activity Detaii
6•00 6:30 0.50 LD3-Jts HWDP
6:30 8:00 1.50 Rig Repairi FixRotating Head Not NippledUp Correctly
8¾ 9:00 1.00 DrillFloat Equipment
9:oo 9:30 0.50 osinActuar 540'-559'
9·30 10:00 0.50 RU Testers For FIT Test
10·00 11:30 1.50 FIT Test {FormationGave gl8.8ppgHeld g|S.6ppg)((8.6-8.34)*(.052)*(540))=7.3psi

11:30 18:00 6.50 DrillActuaW599'-774'
18:00 18:30 0.50 FixLeak in Flow Line
18:30 19'00 0.50 DrillActuall774'-794'
1990 19:30 0.50 Work On Desilter Pump
19:30 23:00 3.50 DriiActuaW794'-894'
23:00 23:30 0.50 Work On Mist Pump Valves
23·30 6:00 6.50 DrillActual/ 894'-1079'I Sliding 1079'-1093'

24.00
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED RIT RECORD

DEPHI NO. OF SACK5/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 2

TwiE ospp SIZE 12 1/4

WEIGHT pac-UL MFG Reed

VIS Pad TYPE M4249DH

wt poly+ .wr open

PV/YP Bed-Zan SEIRALNo. LD6464

MET C-325 DEPTHotrr 1093

CA MyacMe DEPTHIN 540

GES Duragel TOTALFEET 543

ALK Asphasol Has 17.5

pH Max Gel T/8/G

CAME C325 WT. ON err 15K

CL DAR.YCOET $0.00 RPM 55g
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph) 31.0
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL

DRIt.LING ASSE 4BLY PUMP D ITA DEVIATION REDDRD

NCL DESCRIPTION LENGTH - PT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm INCUNATION J Aanmth

1 12.25 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 593 0.6/269.4

1 M.Mtr 28.23 MonEL 8PSO 8PSD 714 0.8/268

1 Shock sub 10.60 STROKE 8.50 8.50 805 1.10/258.8

1 NMDC 10.27 LINERSIzE 6.25 6.25 897 1.40/259.3

2 Gap Sub 3.95 sPM 0 989 1.6/261.5

1 NMDC 30.10 GPN 0.00
6 6' DrillCollars 184.03 SURF PRESSURE 0.0
9 HWDP 276.64 ECD

1 Jars 29.72 SLOW PUMP•SPN O 0
15 +1/2" HWDP 458.02 SLOW PUMP- PRES Û Û

AIR Drilling Operadens data DAILYWEU. UST $54,541
scFM 1200 PREVIOUSCUMcosT $518,250

U:VROU DRAG.XLS BHA 1033.06 IEECTION RATE 28 GPM CUMULATIVEWEu.cost

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, * SEPO4McKinney,Texas 75069 2ÛÛ7

DAKY Opu a rNs REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
U¾E ME &WEU.NO. HRD OR

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 20, 2007
MGME ANDNUMBER COUNEP 6TATE CAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emesy Utah 18
MHROBRM Rat.Hm Rotas NOTAGEDMum LASTON G5EE,WEREN,GMDE SETO aqurtNo.

540' \ 17.5 56 543 13-3/8" 54.5 J-55 540RBK 18
¾ilVHYM REPORTTIME REPORIEDBY

DrillActual jC.E.Crow/ R. M.Crow
REMAMS O TOŒ.

Formation Gave g 8.8ppg He'd g 8.6ppg 15
TIME LO3

FROM TO MOUns Activity Detaii
6•00 6:30 0.50 LD3-Jts HWDP
6:30 8:00 1.50 Rig Repairi FixRotating Head Not NippledUp Correctly
8¾ 9:00 1.00 DrillFloat Equipment
9:oo 9:30 0.50 osinActuar 540'-559'
9·30 10:00 0.50 RU Testers For FIT Test
10·00 11:30 1.50 FIT Test {FormationGave gl8.8ppgHeld g|S.6ppg)((8.6-8.34)*(.052)*(540))=7.3psi

11:30 18:00 6.50 DrillActuaW599'-774'
18:00 18:30 0.50 FixLeak in Flow Line
18:30 19'00 0.50 DrillActuall774'-794'
1990 19:30 0.50 Work On Desilter Pump
19:30 23:00 3.50 DriiActuaW794'-894'
23:00 23:30 0.50 Work On Mist Pump Valves
23·30 6:00 6.50 DrillActual/ 894'-1079'I Sliding 1079'-1093'

24.00
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED RIT RECORD

DEPHI NO. OF SACK5/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 2

TwiE ospp SIZE 12 1/4

WEIGHT pac-UL MFG Reed

VIS Pad TYPE M4249DH

wt poly+ .wr open

PV/YP Bed-Zan SEIRALNo. LD6464

MET C-325 DEPTHotrr 1093

CA MyacMe DEPTHIN 540

GES Duragel TOTALFEET 543

ALK Asphasol Has 17.5

pH Max Gel T/8/G

CAME C325 WT. ON err 15K

CL DAR.YCOET $0.00 RPM 55g
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph) 31.0
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL

DRIt.LING ASSE 4BLY PUMP D ITA DEVIATION REDDRD

NCL DESCRIPTION LENGTH - PT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm INCUNATION J Aanmth

1 12.25 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 593 0.6/269.4

1 M.Mtr 28.23 MonEL 8PSO 8PSD 714 0.8/268

1 Shock sub 10.60 STROKE 8.50 8.50 805 1.10/258.8

1 NMDC 10.27 LINERSIzE 6.25 6.25 897 1.40/259.3

2 Gap Sub 3.95 sPM 0 989 1.6/261.5

1 NMDC 30.10 GPN 0.00
6 6' DrillCollars 184.03 SURF PRESSURE 0.0
9 HWDP 276.64 ECD

1 Jars 29.72 SLOW PUMP•SPN O 0
15 +1/2" HWDP 458.02 SLOW PUMP- PRES Û Û

AIR Drilling Operadens data DAILYWEU. UST $54,541
scFM 1200 PREVIOUSCUMcosT $518,250

U:VROU DRAG.XLS BHA 1033.06 IEECTION RATE 28 GPM CUMULATIVEWEu.cost



Marion Energy inc. . RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069 SEPO4 2007

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.OFOll.,GAS&MINING
HASEMME&WER NŒ HED DW

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clearcreak August 19, 2007
MGMM MD NUMBBt 00UNIY STATE DAYMO.

Unit Drilling Cor). Rig 132 Emery Utah 17
mfÆDMH Rat.ms cum IR Hm fDDTAGEORRUD ASTCABNGSEE, WBGHT, GMDE SET & Reput No.

540' 11.5 38.5 \13-3/8"54.5 J-55 540RBK 17
ACTWHTAfREPORTTHE REPORTEDBY

PU KellyTo DrillOut Float Equipment C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
ammans (HTOGL.

| 15
TIME LOS

FRON TO HOUns Activity Detail
6d0 8:00 2.00 Wait On Parts For Choke Manifold&Welder
8:00 10:00 2.00 Weld Choke ManifoldLinel PU &Lay Down8" Shock Sub &8" Mud Mtr
10BD 11:00 1.00 Weld On Choke Manifold/LayDown8" D.C'S & 1-6" D.C.
11:00 12 30 1.50 Weld On Choke ManifoldLinel PU Dir.Tools
12:30 18:00 5.50 Weld On Choke ManifoldLine
18 00 19:30 1.50 Test Both AllChoke ManifoldValves 3000psi 10min/ 250psi Smin
19 30 0:30 5.00 Work On FlowLine
0:30 1::00 0.50 Work On Rig Lights
1:$0 3:00 2.00 MU BHA &Dir.Tools
3:00 6:00 3.00 TIHTo Drii Out Flaat Equipment

24.00
MUD ÆCORD MUD MATERIAIS USED RIT RECORD

DEVIH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME B1TNO. 2
WIE Dapp SIZE 12 1/4

WEIGHT pac-UL MFG Reed
vis Pac-R TYPE M4249DH
WL Poly+ ,1ET Open

PV/YP FØZan SERIALNo. LD6464
MBT C-325 DEFIN OUT

CA Myackle OEFU IN 540
GELS Duragel TOTALFEET

ALK Asphasol HRS

pH Max Get T/B/G

CAME C325 WT. ON BIT

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)

%sotmS GIMUŒHVE COST $0.00 ANVB.

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP D iTA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. DESCRIPTION MUESTN - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPfH INCLINATION I Ammuth

1 1125 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat
1 M.Mtr 28.23 MODEL 8PSO 8PSO
1 Shock sub 10.60 sTROKE 8.50 8.50
1 NMDC 10.27 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25
2 Gap Sub 3.95 SPM 0
1 NMDC 30.10 GPM 0.00
6 6" DriRCdlans 184.03 SURF PRESSURE 0.0
7 HWDP 215.14 ECD

St.OW PUMP- SPM 0 0
SIDWPUMP-PRES Û Û

AIR DrilEng Operations data DAILYWELLcost $47,958
scm 1800 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $470,292

U:\PRODgx)RLG.XLS SHA 483.82 IEECilON RATE \ 25 GPM CUMULATIVEWELLCOST

Marion Energy inc. . RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069 SEPO4 2007

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.OFOll.,GAS&MINING
HASEMME&WER NŒ HED DW

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clearcreak August 19, 2007
MGMM MD NUMBBt 00UNIY STATE DAYMO.

Unit Drilling Cor). Rig 132 Emery Utah 17
mfÆDMH Rat.ms cum IR Hm fDDTAGEORRUD ASTCABNGSEE, WBGHT, GMDE SET & Reput No.

540' 11.5 38.5 \13-3/8"54.5 J-55 540RBK 17
ACTWHTAfREPORTTHE REPORTEDBY

PU KellyTo DrillOut Float Equipment C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
ammans (HTOGL.

| 15
TIME LOS

FRON TO HOUns Activity Detail
6d0 8:00 2.00 Wait On Parts For Choke Manifold&Welder
8:00 10:00 2.00 Weld Choke ManifoldLinel PU &Lay Down8" Shock Sub &8" Mud Mtr
10BD 11:00 1.00 Weld On Choke Manifold/LayDown8" D.C'S & 1-6" D.C.
11:00 12 30 1.50 Weld On Choke ManifoldLinel PU Dir.Tools
12:30 18:00 5.50 Weld On Choke ManifoldLine
18 00 19:30 1.50 Test Both AllChoke ManifoldValves 3000psi 10min/ 250psi Smin
19 30 0:30 5.00 Work On FlowLine
0:30 1::00 0.50 Work On Rig Lights
1:$0 3:00 2.00 MU BHA &Dir.Tools
3:00 6:00 3.00 TIHTo Drii Out Flaat Equipment

24.00
MUD ÆCORD MUD MATERIAIS USED RIT RECORD

DEVIH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME B1TNO. 2
WIE Dapp SIZE 12 1/4

WEIGHT pac-UL MFG Reed
vis Pac-R TYPE M4249DH
WL Poly+ ,1ET Open

PV/YP FØZan SERIALNo. LD6464
MBT C-325 DEFIN OUT

CA Myackle OEFU IN 540
GELS Duragel TOTALFEET

ALK Asphasol HRS

pH Max Get T/B/G

CAME C325 WT. ON BIT

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)

%sotmS GIMUŒHVE COST $0.00 ANVB.

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP D iTA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. DESCRIPTION MUESTN - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPfH INCLINATION I Ammuth

1 1125 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat
1 M.Mtr 28.23 MODEL 8PSO 8PSO
1 Shock sub 10.60 sTROKE 8.50 8.50
1 NMDC 10.27 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25
2 Gap Sub 3.95 SPM 0
1 NMDC 30.10 GPM 0.00
6 6" DriRCdlans 184.03 SURF PRESSURE 0.0
7 HWDP 215.14 ECD

St.OW PUMP- SPM 0 0
SIDWPUMP-PRES Û Û

AIR DrilEng Operations data DAILYWELLcost $47,958
scm 1800 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $470,292

U:\PRODgx)RLG.XLS SHA 483.82 IEECilON RATE \ 25 GPM CUMULATIVEWELLCOST

Marion Energy inc. . RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069 SEPO4 2007

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.OFOll.,GAS&MINING
HASEMME&WER NŒ HED DW

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clearcreak August 19, 2007
MGMM MD NUMBBt 00UNIY STATE DAYMO.

Unit Drilling Cor). Rig 132 Emery Utah 17
mfÆDMH Rat.ms cum IR Hm fDDTAGEORRUD ASTCABNGSEE, WBGHT, GMDE SET & Reput No.

540' 11.5 38.5 \13-3/8"54.5 J-55 540RBK 17
ACTWHTAfREPORTTHE REPORTEDBY

PU KellyTo DrillOut Float Equipment C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
ammans (HTOGL.

| 15
TIME LOS

FRON TO HOUns Activity Detail
6d0 8:00 2.00 Wait On Parts For Choke Manifold&Welder
8:00 10:00 2.00 Weld Choke ManifoldLinel PU &Lay Down8" Shock Sub &8" Mud Mtr
10BD 11:00 1.00 Weld On Choke Manifold/LayDown8" D.C'S & 1-6" D.C.
11:00 12 30 1.50 Weld On Choke ManifoldLinel PU Dir.Tools
12:30 18:00 5.50 Weld On Choke ManifoldLine
18 00 19:30 1.50 Test Both AllChoke ManifoldValves 3000psi 10min/ 250psi Smin
19 30 0:30 5.00 Work On FlowLine
0:30 1::00 0.50 Work On Rig Lights
1:$0 3:00 2.00 MU BHA &Dir.Tools
3:00 6:00 3.00 TIHTo Drii Out Flaat Equipment

24.00
MUD ÆCORD MUD MATERIAIS USED RIT RECORD

DEVIH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME B1TNO. 2
WIE Dapp SIZE 12 1/4

WEIGHT pac-UL MFG Reed
vis Pac-R TYPE M4249DH
WL Poly+ ,1ET Open

PV/YP FØZan SERIALNo. LD6464
MBT C-325 DEFIN OUT

CA Myackle OEFU IN 540
GELS Duragel TOTALFEET

ALK Asphasol HRS

pH Max Get T/B/G

CAME C325 WT. ON BIT

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)

%sotmS GIMUŒHVE COST $0.00 ANVB.

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP D iTA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. DESCRIPTION MUESTN - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPfH INCLINATION I Ammuth

1 1125 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat
1 M.Mtr 28.23 MODEL 8PSO 8PSO
1 Shock sub 10.60 sTROKE 8.50 8.50
1 NMDC 10.27 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25
2 Gap Sub 3.95 SPM 0
1 NMDC 30.10 GPM 0.00
6 6" DriRCdlans 184.03 SURF PRESSURE 0.0
7 HWDP 215.14 ECD

St.OW PUMP- SPM 0 0
SIDWPUMP-PRES Û Û

AIR DrilEng Operations data DAILYWELLcost $47,958
scm 1800 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $470,292

U:\PRODgx)RLG.XLS SHA 483.82 IEECilON RATE \ 25 GPM CUMULATIVEWELLCOST



Marion Energy inc- RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee Ste

McKinney,Texas Ÿ5069 SEPO4 2007

DAILY DRTE I ING REPORT ONOFOlgGAS&MINING
unsemmawaLNO.

.HRD DW

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 18, 2007

RIGMMAND MUMBER
COUm STm DAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 16

TufALDER Rot.½s aHm FOOTAGEÐRI lASTCAS-GSizE,WEIGHT,GRADE SETO ReputNo.

54& 11.5 38.5 |13-3/8"54.5 J-55 540RBK 16
ACTIVNTAFREPORTTIME

REPORTEDBY

Waiting On Choke ManifoldParts & Welder C.E. Crow/R. M. Crow
ROIARES

IB TOGL

issues Getting Seal On WellEand & Orig. Flanget Issues Finding2X Fittings For Choke Manifold 15

TIME LO s

MON TO MOURS ACtiVity Detail

6:00 8:00 2.00 Rig Up BOPE Testers
8:00 8:30 0.50 Rig Senrice

8:30 11:00 2.50 Rig Repair Replace SwivelPacking
11:00 Test Upper & LowerKeiy Valve 3000pei 10min/250psi 5min/FunctionTest Accumulator! Test Nitrogen

Bottles On Acc.1000psi/Check Usuable Fluid in Acc 1200psil CheckCapacity Of Acc/

16:30 5.50 Test FOSV &Inside BOP 3000psi 10minI250psi 5min!Test Back To Pumps 1940psi

16:30 18:00 1.50 Test Pipe Rams Failed/ Leaking At DriHingFlangel Re-Tighten Driling Flangel Re-test Pipe Rams

1890 Lossen DriDingFlange & LiftStack Visuaiy inspect Ring Gasket/ Reset Stack & Driling Flange

Retest Pipe Rams Failed/ Lossen DriRingFlange & LiftStack! PullRing Gasket &Reset Sinck

23:00 5.00 Tighten DriHingFlange
23:00 Test BOPE Test Ann 2500psi 10min/ 250psi Smin!Test PipeRams 3000psi 10min/ 250psi 5-Min

Test BlindRams 3000psi 10min/ 250psi5min! Test inside & Outside HCR 3000psi 10min/ 250psi 5min

1:00 2.00 Test Kii Lines Valves insie & Outside 3000psi 10min! 25psi 5min

id0 1:30 0.50 Test 13-3/8" Surface Csq 1500psi/ 30min

1:30 6:00 4.50 Wait On Targeted 2XTargeted Tee's & Babbit For Choke Manifold

24.00
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIAL S USED BITRECORD

DEPN NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1

TmE Dapp SI2E 17 1/2"

WElair
pac-uL MFG Smith / Retip

VIS
Pac-R TYPE XRTVC

W1.
Poly+ JET Open

PV/YP
Fed-Zan SERIALNo. RSTMR3869

MST
C-325 DEPm OUT 540'

CA
MyacNe DEPN 1N 55'

GELS
Duragel TOTALFEET 495

ALX
Asphasol HRs 38.5
Max Gei T/B/G 2,2,wt,a,e,1,nd,td

CAKE
C325 WT. ON BIT 12-15 K

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM 55-84

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph) 12.8

%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL 289.0

DRILt.ING ASSE 1BLY PUMP D sTA DEVIATION REWRD

NO. DESCRIPTION 1.ENSTN - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION I Azmuth

i 17 1/2" Toothbit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat

1 XO Sub 237 MoDEL SPSÛ BPBÛ

1 9 5/8 " PDM 36.97 STROKE 8.50 8.50

1 Shocksub 10.60 LINERSIžE 6.25 6.25

2 8" Drii Coiars 59.90 SPM 0

1 XO Sub 2.50 GPM 0.00

6 6" DrillCollars 184.03 SURFPRESSURE O.Û

6 HWDP 184.38 ECD

$LOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
SLOW PUMP- PRES Û Û

AIR DrBHng Operadens data DA1LYWELLCOST $42,991
scm 1800 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $427,301

U:VRODVMmtG.XLS SHA 482.25 IMECTION RATE 25

Marion Energy inc- RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee Ste

McKinney,Texas Ÿ5069 SEPO4 2007

DAILY DRTE I ING REPORT ONOFOlgGAS&MINING
unsemmawaLNO.

.HRD DW

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 18, 2007

RIGMMAND MUMBER
COUm STm DAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 16

TufALDER Rot.½s aHm FOOTAGEÐRI lASTCAS-GSizE,WEIGHT,GRADE SETO ReputNo.

54& 11.5 38.5 |13-3/8"54.5 J-55 540RBK 16
ACTIVNTAFREPORTTIME

REPORTEDBY

Waiting On Choke ManifoldParts & Welder C.E. Crow/R. M. Crow
ROIARES

IB TOGL

issues Getting Seal On WellEand & Orig. Flanget Issues Finding2X Fittings For Choke Manifold 15

TIME LO s

MON TO MOURS ACtiVity Detail

6:00 8:00 2.00 Rig Up BOPE Testers
8:00 8:30 0.50 Rig Senrice

8:30 11:00 2.50 Rig Repair Replace SwivelPacking
11:00 Test Upper & LowerKeiy Valve 3000pei 10min/250psi 5min/FunctionTest Accumulator! Test Nitrogen

Bottles On Acc.1000psi/Check Usuable Fluid in Acc 1200psil CheckCapacity Of Acc/

16:30 5.50 Test FOSV &Inside BOP 3000psi 10minI250psi 5min!Test Back To Pumps 1940psi

16:30 18:00 1.50 Test Pipe Rams Failed/ Leaking At DriHingFlangel Re-Tighten Driling Flangel Re-test Pipe Rams

1890 Lossen DriDingFlange & LiftStack Visuaiy inspect Ring Gasket/ Reset Stack & Driling Flange

Retest Pipe Rams Failed/ Lossen DriRingFlange & LiftStack! PullRing Gasket &Reset Sinck

23:00 5.00 Tighten DriHingFlange
23:00 Test BOPE Test Ann 2500psi 10min/ 250psi Smin!Test PipeRams 3000psi 10min/ 250psi 5-Min

Test BlindRams 3000psi 10min/ 250psi5min! Test inside & Outside HCR 3000psi 10min/ 250psi 5min

1:00 2.00 Test Kii Lines Valves insie & Outside 3000psi 10min! 25psi 5min

id0 1:30 0.50 Test 13-3/8" Surface Csq 1500psi/ 30min

1:30 6:00 4.50 Wait On Targeted 2XTargeted Tee's & Babbit For Choke Manifold

24.00
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIAL S USED BITRECORD

DEPN NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1

TmE Dapp SI2E 17 1/2"

WElair
pac-uL MFG Smith / Retip

VIS
Pac-R TYPE XRTVC

W1.
Poly+ JET Open

PV/YP
Fed-Zan SERIALNo. RSTMR3869

MST
C-325 DEPm OUT 540'

CA
MyacNe DEPN 1N 55'

GELS
Duragel TOTALFEET 495

ALX
Asphasol HRs 38.5
Max Gei T/B/G 2,2,wt,a,e,1,nd,td

CAKE
C325 WT. ON BIT 12-15 K

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM 55-84

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph) 12.8

%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL 289.0

DRILt.ING ASSE 1BLY PUMP D sTA DEVIATION REWRD

NO. DESCRIPTION 1.ENSTN - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION I Azmuth

i 17 1/2" Toothbit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat

1 XO Sub 237 MoDEL SPSÛ BPBÛ

1 9 5/8 " PDM 36.97 STROKE 8.50 8.50

1 Shocksub 10.60 LINERSIžE 6.25 6.25

2 8" Drii Coiars 59.90 SPM 0

1 XO Sub 2.50 GPM 0.00

6 6" DrillCollars 184.03 SURFPRESSURE O.Û

6 HWDP 184.38 ECD

$LOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
SLOW PUMP- PRES Û Û

AIR DrBHng Operadens data DA1LYWELLCOST $42,991
scm 1800 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $427,301

U:VRODVMmtG.XLS SHA 482.25 IMECTION RATE 25



Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 s Tennessee, ste SEPO4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAR.Y DPTi i TNG REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
umE ME&WELM HED DME

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak August 17, 2007
RIGME ANDmmBER COUmY STME DAYNO.

Unit Drilling Cor2. Rig 132 Emery Utah 15
vara esam Rat. His aan Rot. Ms FOGTMEDRUED M5tus-G SIZE,WEGHT,GRADE SET @ Re¡xrt No.

540' 11.5 38.5 13-3/8" 54.5 J-55 540RBK 15
ACTNHTAFREFORTTIME REPORTEDBY

NipplingupBOPEStack C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
REMARIS KBTOGL

Cmt 12 Jis 540' 134Æ" 54.5£ J4i5 STC W/540sks 382Culft 15.8ppg 1.15yeild5.OgallskClass-G Cmt | 15
TIME10 31

man To Houns Activity Detail
6·00 10:00 4.00 Run 12 Jts 1&38"54.5# STC J-55 Csq Depth 540'
10:00 12:00 2.00 Rig Up Cementers
12'00 Pump 60bbis Mud Flush WI Super Sweep/ 110 bbis Cement!76bbis Displacement/ 30bb's Cmt Retumed

14:00 2.00 Pump 540sks Class-G 382cu/ft 110bbis 15.8ppg 1.15yield 5.0 gallskCement/ Bump Plug g850psi
1440 15·00 1.00 Floats Held/Rig Down Cementers
15:00 16:30 1.50 Wait On Cement
16:30 Rig Up Welderi Cut Flow Line To Busterl Dig CelfarOut 18" For Welder/ Cut Casingf Lay Down Csq

19:30 3.00 MoveSpider/ Slips/ Rolating Head & Misc Epiup. Out Of Sub
19:30 22:30 3.00 Set Well Head And Pre-Heat Weilheadt Weld Onto Casing
22:30 0:30 2.00 Let Well Head Cool Off & Test To 2500psi
0:30 2:30 2.00 Tum Check &Gate Valves On Double Ram
2:30 6:00 3.50 NippleUp BOP Stack

24.00
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED 31T RECORD

DEPHI NO. OF SACKS/LSS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
TIME Dapp 512E 17 1/2"
WEIGHT pac-UL MFG Smith / Retip
VIS Pac-R TYPE XRTVC
WI. Poly+ JET Open

PVfYP i;ed-Zan SERIALNo. RSTMR3869
MBT C-325 DEPHI OUT 540'
CA Myacide DEPTHIN 55'
GELS Duragel TOTALFEET 495
ALK Asphasol HRS 38.5

pH Max Get TIB/G 2,2,wt,a,e,1,nd,td

cAKE C325 WT. ON BIr 12-15 K
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM 55-84

DAPP PREV10USCOST fph) 12.8
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL 289.0

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP D 4TA DEVIATION REDORD
N(A DESCRIPflON f.ENGTH- FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPHI INCUNATION / Azmuth

1 17 1/2" Tooth bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat

1 XO Sub 2.37 MoDEL SPSO SPSO
1 9 5/8 " PDM 36.97 synoKE 8.50 8.50
1 Shocksub 10.60 UNER SIZE 6.25 6.25
2 8" DrillCollars 59.90 sPM 0
1 XO Sub 2.50 GPM 0.00
6 6" DrillCollars 184.03 SURFPRESSURE 0.0
6 HWDP 184.38 ECD

SLOWPUMP- SPM 0 0
St.OW PUMP- PRES O O

AIR orunneoperauonsdata DAILYWELLCOST $99,185
sCFM 180Û PREVIOUSCUMCOST $328,116

U:\PROD DRLG.XLs BHA 482.25 ImECHON RATE 25 GPM cuMutATIVE WELLCOST

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 s Tennessee, ste SEPO4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAR.Y DPTi i TNG REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
umE ME&WELM HED DME

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak August 17, 2007
RIGME ANDmmBER COUmY STME DAYNO.

Unit Drilling Cor2. Rig 132 Emery Utah 15
vara esam Rat. His aan Rot. Ms FOGTMEDRUED M5tus-G SIZE,WEGHT,GRADE SET @ Re¡xrt No.

540' 11.5 38.5 13-3/8" 54.5 J-55 540RBK 15
ACTNHTAFREFORTTIME REPORTEDBY

NipplingupBOPEStack C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
REMARIS KBTOGL

Cmt 12 Jis 540' 134Æ" 54.5£ J4i5 STC W/540sks 382Culft 15.8ppg 1.15yeild5.OgallskClass-G Cmt | 15
TIME10 31

man To Houns Activity Detail
6·00 10:00 4.00 Run 12 Jts 1&38"54.5# STC J-55 Csq Depth 540'
10:00 12:00 2.00 Rig Up Cementers
12'00 Pump 60bbis Mud Flush WI Super Sweep/ 110 bbis Cement!76bbis Displacement/ 30bb's Cmt Retumed

14:00 2.00 Pump 540sks Class-G 382cu/ft 110bbis 15.8ppg 1.15yield 5.0 gallskCement/ Bump Plug g850psi
1440 15·00 1.00 Floats Held/Rig Down Cementers
15:00 16:30 1.50 Wait On Cement
16:30 Rig Up Welderi Cut Flow Line To Busterl Dig CelfarOut 18" For Welder/ Cut Casingf Lay Down Csq

19:30 3.00 MoveSpider/ Slips/ Rolating Head & Misc Epiup. Out Of Sub
19:30 22:30 3.00 Set Well Head And Pre-Heat Weilheadt Weld Onto Casing
22:30 0:30 2.00 Let Well Head Cool Off & Test To 2500psi
0:30 2:30 2.00 Tum Check &Gate Valves On Double Ram
2:30 6:00 3.50 NippleUp BOP Stack

24.00
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED 31T RECORD

DEPHI NO. OF SACKS/LSS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
TIME Dapp 512E 17 1/2"
WEIGHT pac-UL MFG Smith / Retip
VIS Pac-R TYPE XRTVC
WI. Poly+ JET Open

PVfYP i;ed-Zan SERIALNo. RSTMR3869
MBT C-325 DEPHI OUT 540'
CA Myacide DEPTHIN 55'
GELS Duragel TOTALFEET 495
ALK Asphasol HRS 38.5

pH Max Get TIB/G 2,2,wt,a,e,1,nd,td

cAKE C325 WT. ON BIr 12-15 K
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM 55-84

DAPP PREV10USCOST fph) 12.8
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL 289.0

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP D 4TA DEVIATION REDORD
N(A DESCRIPflON f.ENGTH- FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPHI INCUNATION / Azmuth

1 17 1/2" Tooth bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat

1 XO Sub 2.37 MoDEL SPSO SPSO
1 9 5/8 " PDM 36.97 synoKE 8.50 8.50
1 Shocksub 10.60 UNER SIZE 6.25 6.25
2 8" DrillCollars 59.90 sPM 0
1 XO Sub 2.50 GPM 0.00
6 6" DrillCollars 184.03 SURFPRESSURE 0.0
6 HWDP 184.38 ECD

SLOWPUMP- SPM 0 0
St.OW PUMP- PRES O O

AIR orunneoperauonsdata DAILYWELLCOST $99,185
sCFM 180Û PREVIOUSCUMCOST $328,116

U:\PROD DRLG.XLs BHA 482.25 ImECHON RATE 25 GPM cuMutATIVE WELLCOST



Marion Energy inc. RECElVED

gf "g¶g, SEPOfi 2007

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV,OFOIL,GAS&MINING
LEASENME&WELLND. HED DME

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 16, 2007
RIGNAMEANDMUMBER COUKW STATE DAYND.

Unit Drilling Cor). Rig 132 Emery Utah 14
WTALDWH Rat.ms am ant.nz FOOTAGEORRED (ASTCASMGSEE, WBGNT,GRADE SET# ReimmtNo.

540' 11.5 38.5 183' 20" Line pipe conductor 55' RKB 14
AcnVUYAf RENRYTME REFORTEDBY

Pickingup 13 3/8" casing. ¡R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
REMARIS KBTOGL

casingcrew arrived at location at 03:3o j 15
TEME1.01|

FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 7:00 1.00 Wireline survey @357 =

.5

7:00 13:30 6.50 Drilling17 1/2" hole with 1800 ofmAirand 25 gpm soap and water From 357 to 463'
13:30 14:00 0.50 Lubricate rig
14:00 16:30 150 Drilling17 171"hole with 1800 ofm Airand 25 gpm soap and water From 463' to 512'

16:30 17:00 0.50 Payson workingon crown on depth sender.
17dD 17:30 0.50 Drilling17 112°hole with 1800 cfm Airand 25 gpmsoap and water From 512' to 520'
17:30 19:00 1.50 Circulate Holewith 1200 ofm./ unload and strap 13 3/8" casing.
19:00 19:30 0.50 Drilling17 1/2° hole with 1800 ofm Airand 25 ppm soap and water From 520' To 540' to ilt casing
19'3D 20:30 1.00 Short tripio 8" drii collars discovered a issue with tallytripback in hole.(the pipe count was off 1 joint)
20:30 22:00 1.50 Drillto 540' toadjust Tallyproblem.
22•00 23:00 1.00 Wireline Survey g 483' = Miss run.
23:00 0:00 1.00 Pull out of hole for Casing.
0:00 3:00 3.00 Rig up Spider on topof Conductor head, set slips on mud motor strip off rotating head bearing assembly
3 4:30 1.50 Laydown Shock sub motor and bit.
4:30 6:00 1.50 Rig up casing crew.

24.00
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIAL S USED SIT RECORD

DEPm NO. OF SACKSILBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
TIME Dapp SIZE 17 1/2*

WEIGfT pac-UL Mas Smith / Retip
vis PaeR TYPE XRTVC
WL Poly+ JET open
PV/YP Fed-Zan SERIALNo. RSTMR3869
MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT 540'
CA Myadde DEPm 1N 55'
GELS Duragel TUTALFEET 495
ALX Asphasol HRs 38.5
pH . Max Get T/B/G 2,2,wt,a,e,1,nd,td

CAME C325 WT. ON BIT 12-15 K
CL DAlLYWST 40.00 RPM 55-84

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph) 12.8
%SOUDS .

CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL 289.0
DRIt.i.ING ASSE 1BLY PUMP D TA DEVETION RE::ORD

NCA DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmu

i 17 1/2" Tooth bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat

1 XO Sub 2.37 NoDEL SPSD SPSO
1 9 5/8 " PDM 36.97 s1RoKE 8.50 8.50
1 Shocksub 10.60 1.INERSIZE 6.25 6.25
2 8" Drill Collars 59.90 sPM 0
1 XO Sub 2.50 GPM 0.00
6 6" DrillCoHars 184.03 sURF PRESSURE 0.0
6 HWDP 184.38 ECD

SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
51.DW PUNP- PRE$ Û

AIR Drilling Operations data OAILYWEli COST $32,937
SCFM 1800 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $296,19

U:VRODgmLG.XLS BHA 482.25 ImECTION RATE 25 GPM CUMULATIVEWELLCOST

Marion Energy inc. RECElVED

gf "g¶g, SEPOfi 2007

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV,OFOIL,GAS&MINING
LEASENME&WELLND. HED DME

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 16, 2007
RIGNAMEANDMUMBER COUKW STATE DAYND.

Unit Drilling Cor). Rig 132 Emery Utah 14
WTALDWH Rat.ms am ant.nz FOOTAGEORRED (ASTCASMGSEE, WBGNT,GRADE SET# ReimmtNo.

540' 11.5 38.5 183' 20" Line pipe conductor 55' RKB 14
AcnVUYAf RENRYTME REFORTEDBY

Pickingup 13 3/8" casing. ¡R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
REMARIS KBTOGL

casingcrew arrived at location at 03:3o j 15
TEME1.01|

FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 7:00 1.00 Wireline survey @357 =

.5

7:00 13:30 6.50 Drilling17 1/2" hole with 1800 ofmAirand 25 gpm soap and water From 357 to 463'
13:30 14:00 0.50 Lubricate rig
14:00 16:30 150 Drilling17 171"hole with 1800 ofm Airand 25 gpm soap and water From 463' to 512'

16:30 17:00 0.50 Payson workingon crown on depth sender.
17dD 17:30 0.50 Drilling17 112°hole with 1800 cfm Airand 25 gpmsoap and water From 512' to 520'
17:30 19:00 1.50 Circulate Holewith 1200 ofm./ unload and strap 13 3/8" casing.
19:00 19:30 0.50 Drilling17 1/2° hole with 1800 ofm Airand 25 ppm soap and water From 520' To 540' to ilt casing
19'3D 20:30 1.00 Short tripio 8" drii collars discovered a issue with tallytripback in hole.(the pipe count was off 1 joint)
20:30 22:00 1.50 Drillto 540' toadjust Tallyproblem.
22•00 23:00 1.00 Wireline Survey g 483' = Miss run.
23:00 0:00 1.00 Pull out of hole for Casing.
0:00 3:00 3.00 Rig up Spider on topof Conductor head, set slips on mud motor strip off rotating head bearing assembly
3 4:30 1.50 Laydown Shock sub motor and bit.
4:30 6:00 1.50 Rig up casing crew.

24.00
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIAL S USED SIT RECORD

DEPm NO. OF SACKSILBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
TIME Dapp SIZE 17 1/2*

WEIGfT pac-UL Mas Smith / Retip
vis PaeR TYPE XRTVC
WL Poly+ JET open
PV/YP Fed-Zan SERIALNo. RSTMR3869
MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT 540'
CA Myadde DEPm 1N 55'
GELS Duragel TUTALFEET 495
ALX Asphasol HRs 38.5
pH . Max Get T/B/G 2,2,wt,a,e,1,nd,td

CAME C325 WT. ON BIT 12-15 K
CL DAlLYWST 40.00 RPM 55-84

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph) 12.8
%SOUDS .

CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL 289.0
DRIt.i.ING ASSE 1BLY PUMP D TA DEVETION RE::ORD

NCA DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmu

i 17 1/2" Tooth bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat

1 XO Sub 2.37 NoDEL SPSD SPSO
1 9 5/8 " PDM 36.97 s1RoKE 8.50 8.50
1 Shocksub 10.60 1.INERSIZE 6.25 6.25
2 8" Drill Collars 59.90 sPM 0
1 XO Sub 2.50 GPM 0.00
6 6" DrillCoHars 184.03 sURF PRESSURE 0.0
6 HWDP 184.38 ECD

SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
51.DW PUNP- PRE$ Û

AIR Drilling Operations data OAILYWEli COST $32,937
SCFM 1800 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $296,19

U:VRODgmLG.XLS BHA 482.25 ImECTION RATE 25 GPM CUMULATIVEWELLCOST



Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED

Ån"nw fŠs SEPO4 2007

DAILY DPTI i TIUGREPORT
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

185E MME&WEU.ND. BRD DW

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 15, 2007
MGNMIEMIDMUMBER COUNTY STATE DAYNO.

UnitDrilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 13
10TALEEN M. Hm a as fDUTAGE ÐMRED LASTCASHIG SizE, WEER, GMDE SETO Reisrt a

357 8 8 37' 20" Line pipeconductor 55' RKB 13
AcrWNE ROWi EME WORD BY

Drillinq@365' |R.LTatman / Shiloh Williams
REMAME KBTOGL

\ 15
TIME LO 2

FROM TO HOURS ActiVity Detail
6:00 7:30 1.50 Lay down 8" drillcoiars, pickup Hwdp because the 8" Do cent be puled throughrotating head rubber.

7:30 15:30 8.00 DriHing17 1/2" hole with 1200 cfm Airand 25 gpmsoap and water From 92' to 189'
15:30 17:30 2.00 Lay down 3 jts HWDP & Pick up 2 8" do and 1 6" dc
17:30 18:00 0.50 Rig repairs / tightenup connection between the swivet and Kelly spinner.
18·00 3:00 9.00 Driling17 1/2" hole with 1800 cfm Airand 25 ppmsoap and water From 189' to 340"
3·00 4:00 1.00 Installnew rotating head rubber.
4'00 6:00 2.00 Driling 17 1/2" hole with mud motor, 1800 cfm Airand 25 gpmsoap and water From 340' to 35T

24.00
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED BIT RECORD

DEPIN NO, OF SACKS/LßS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
TIME Dapp SEE 17 1/2"

WEHff pac-UL MFG Smith / Retip
VIS Pac-R TYPE XRTVC
WL Poir+ JET Op€n

PV/TP Fed-Zan SERIALNo. RSTMR3869
MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA MyacMe ÐEPHI IN 55'
GELS Duragel TOTALFEET 37'
ALK Asphasol HRS 8
pH Max Get T/B/G

CAME C325 Wr. ON BIT 9-12 K
CL DMLYCOST $0.00 RPM 55-84

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph) 4.5
%SOtm5 CUMULATIVECOST $0,00 ANVEL 277.0

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP D ITA DEVIATION REDORD
MKA DESCRIPTION LENGTN - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCI..INATION / Azmuth

1 17 1/2" Tooth bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat
1 XOSub 2.37 MODEi. SPSO 8P30
1 9 5/8 * PDM 36.97 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Shocksub 10.60 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
2 8" Dril Coiars 59.90 sPM 0
1 XO Sub 2.50 GPM 0.00
6 6" DrillCollars 184.03 SURF PRESSURE 0.0
1 HWDP 30.91 ECD

SLOW PUMP- SPM O O
SLOW PUMP- PREs O O

AIR DrBIIngOperations data DAILYWELLCOST $26,854
SCFM 1800 PREVIOUSCUMWST $224320

u:\pnoogxmLG.XIs BHA 328.78 ImECTIONRATE j 25GPM CUMULÄHVEWELLGOST

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED

Ån"nw fŠs SEPO4 2007

DAILY DPTI i TIUGREPORT
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

185E MME&WEU.ND. BRD DW

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 15, 2007
MGNMIEMIDMUMBER COUNTY STATE DAYNO.

UnitDrilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 13
10TALEEN M. Hm a as fDUTAGE ÐMRED LASTCASHIG SizE, WEER, GMDE SETO Reisrt a

357 8 8 37' 20" Line pipeconductor 55' RKB 13
AcrWNE ROWi EME WORD BY

Drillinq@365' |R.LTatman / Shiloh Williams
REMAME KBTOGL

\ 15
TIME LO 2

FROM TO HOURS ActiVity Detail
6:00 7:30 1.50 Lay down 8" drillcoiars, pickup Hwdp because the 8" Do cent be puled throughrotating head rubber.

7:30 15:30 8.00 DriHing17 1/2" hole with 1200 cfm Airand 25 gpmsoap and water From 92' to 189'
15:30 17:30 2.00 Lay down 3 jts HWDP & Pick up 2 8" do and 1 6" dc
17:30 18:00 0.50 Rig repairs / tightenup connection between the swivet and Kelly spinner.
18·00 3:00 9.00 Driling17 1/2" hole with 1800 cfm Airand 25 ppmsoap and water From 189' to 340"
3·00 4:00 1.00 Installnew rotating head rubber.
4'00 6:00 2.00 Driling 17 1/2" hole with mud motor, 1800 cfm Airand 25 gpmsoap and water From 340' to 35T

24.00
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED BIT RECORD

DEPIN NO, OF SACKS/LßS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
TIME Dapp SEE 17 1/2"

WEHff pac-UL MFG Smith / Retip
VIS Pac-R TYPE XRTVC
WL Poir+ JET Op€n

PV/TP Fed-Zan SERIALNo. RSTMR3869
MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA MyacMe ÐEPHI IN 55'
GELS Duragel TOTALFEET 37'
ALK Asphasol HRS 8
pH Max Get T/B/G

CAME C325 Wr. ON BIT 9-12 K
CL DMLYCOST $0.00 RPM 55-84

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph) 4.5
%SOtm5 CUMULATIVECOST $0,00 ANVEL 277.0

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP D ITA DEVIATION REDORD
MKA DESCRIPTION LENGTN - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCI..INATION / Azmuth

1 17 1/2" Tooth bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat
1 XOSub 2.37 MODEi. SPSO 8P30
1 9 5/8 * PDM 36.97 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Shocksub 10.60 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
2 8" Dril Coiars 59.90 sPM 0
1 XO Sub 2.50 GPM 0.00
6 6" DrillCollars 184.03 SURF PRESSURE 0.0
1 HWDP 30.91 ECD

SLOW PUMP- SPM O O
SLOW PUMP- PREs O O

AIR DrBIIngOperations data DAILYWELLCOST $26,854
SCFM 1800 PREVIOUSCUMWST $224320

u:\pnoogxmLG.XIs BHA 328.78 ImECTIONRATE j 25GPM CUMULÄHVEWELLGOST



Marion Energy inc. RECElVED
119 s Tennessee, ste SEPO4 2007

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DETI i HIG REPORT
OfV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING

ŒASEMERWEU.NO. HED Om

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 14, 2007
100 MMMID WUBIBER COUNDP TE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling CorJ. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 12
TorAI.DEPM ik as cum ik as FDDTAGEÐRRI.ED LASTCASHIGSizE, WEIGiŒ, GRADE SETO Repst No.

55' | 8 8 37' |20"Line pipe conductor 55' RKB 12
acrumrewaar me womour
Drillinq@92' R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams

KBTOGL

Formalionis very hard at surf te driling is slow due to very little weight. 15
TIME LOG

MON TO HOURS Activity Detail
6·00 8:30 2.50 Pick up bit mud motor and crossover sub,Torque bitand moinr.
8:30 Instal Bearing assemble on rotating head.Hook up circulatingsystem from tanks to buster and test, fut

19:00 10.50 Fix leaks lost water out of mud tanks,wait on water truck.Hook up and test cellar pump.
19:00 20:30 1.50 Drillout cement with fresh water and no air to 63' install rotating head rubber.
20:30 22:00 1.50 Rig repairs / Repair air line goingto ritaryclutch.
22·00 6:00 8.00 Driling 17 112"hole with 1200 cfm Airand 25 gpmsoap and waterFrom 63' io 92'

24.00
MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD

DEFW NO. OF SAC¾S/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
TlME Dapp SIZE 17 1/2"

WEIGIT pac-UL MFG Smith / Retip

VlS Pac-R TYPE XRTVC
WL Poly+ .1ET Open

PVlYP Fed-Zan SERIALNo. RSTMR3869
MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA MyacMe ÐEPTH1N 55'
GELS Duragel TOTA1.FEET 37'
ALK Asphasof HRS 8
pH Max Gei T/B/G

CAKE C325 wr. oN Brr 9-12 K
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM 55-65

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph) 4.5
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 AN VEL 277.0

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP DITA DEVL IIION REDORD
MA DESCRIPTION l.ENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm INCLINATION / Ammuth

i 17 1/2" Tooth bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat
1 XOSub 2.37 MoDEi. SPSO SPSO
1 9 5/8 * PDM 36.97 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Shock sub 10.60 1.INER SIžE 6.25 6.25
1 XO Sub sPM 0

GPM 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD

SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
SIDW PUMP- PRES O O

AIR DrilBug Operations data DAILYWELLCOST $72,859
SCFM 1200 PREVIOUSCUMCOST

_

$222320
U WROUWORLG.XLS SHA 1 48.88 IEECTION RATE 25 GPM CUMULATIVEWELLcosT

Marion Energy inc. RECElVED
119 s Tennessee, ste SEPO4 2007

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DETI i HIG REPORT
OfV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING

ŒASEMERWEU.NO. HED Om

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 14, 2007
100 MMMID WUBIBER COUNDP TE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling CorJ. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 12
TorAI.DEPM ik as cum ik as FDDTAGEÐRRI.ED LASTCASHIGSizE, WEIGiŒ, GRADE SETO Repst No.

55' | 8 8 37' |20"Line pipe conductor 55' RKB 12
acrumrewaar me womour
Drillinq@92' R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams

KBTOGL

Formalionis very hard at surf te driling is slow due to very little weight. 15
TIME LOG

MON TO HOURS Activity Detail
6·00 8:30 2.50 Pick up bit mud motor and crossover sub,Torque bitand moinr.
8:30 Instal Bearing assemble on rotating head.Hook up circulatingsystem from tanks to buster and test, fut

19:00 10.50 Fix leaks lost water out of mud tanks,wait on water truck.Hook up and test cellar pump.
19:00 20:30 1.50 Drillout cement with fresh water and no air to 63' install rotating head rubber.
20:30 22:00 1.50 Rig repairs / Repair air line goingto ritaryclutch.
22·00 6:00 8.00 Driling 17 112"hole with 1200 cfm Airand 25 gpmsoap and waterFrom 63' io 92'

24.00
MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD

DEFW NO. OF SAC¾S/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
TlME Dapp SIZE 17 1/2"

WEIGIT pac-UL MFG Smith / Retip

VlS Pac-R TYPE XRTVC
WL Poly+ .1ET Open

PVlYP Fed-Zan SERIALNo. RSTMR3869
MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA MyacMe ÐEPTH1N 55'
GELS Duragel TOTA1.FEET 37'
ALK Asphasof HRS 8
pH Max Gei T/B/G

CAKE C325 wr. oN Brr 9-12 K
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM 55-65

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph) 4.5
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 AN VEL 277.0

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP DITA DEVL IIION REDORD
MA DESCRIPTION l.ENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm INCLINATION / Ammuth

i 17 1/2" Tooth bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat
1 XOSub 2.37 MoDEi. SPSO SPSO
1 9 5/8 * PDM 36.97 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Shock sub 10.60 1.INER SIžE 6.25 6.25
1 XO Sub sPM 0

GPM 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD

SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
SIDW PUMP- PRES O O

AIR DrilBug Operations data DAILYWELLCOST $72,859
SCFM 1200 PREVIOUSCUMCOST

_

$222320
U WROUWORLG.XLS SHA 1 48.88 IEECTION RATE 25 GPM CUMULATIVEWELLcosT



Marion Energy inc.
RECEIVED

Un &¶g, SEPO't2007

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
DAB.Y DRB.LING REPORT

uASEMM &WEU.ND. HRD Em

Ridge Runner 8-19 ClearCreak August 13, 2007
W NW MD MUMBER 00UNIY STR Mr ND.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 11
HERBENE R Ma ast. mz UGTAGEDRED IA570tSmG SizE,WElGHT, DE SEf@ aspat No.

40' 0 0 0 20" Line pipeconductor 40' . 11
ACTIVETMMEFORTTIME REFORTEDBY

Riqqing Up ( Prespud safety inspection. R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
REN-5 m TOGl.

15
TIME LC3i

MON TO HOURS Activity Detail
6 00 18:00 12.00 Rig up I Rig up front yardset catwalk and pipetub inove pusher shack and generatorto set piperacks.
18'00 6:00 12.00 Set dog hous steps Weld on gas buster and puthandrails on new stair hay platforrn,strap Bha and Une

up toolsto spud.

24.00
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS USED 3IT RECORD

DEWTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Dapp S12E

WEIGHT pa MFG

VlS Pac-R TYPE

Wi. Pol¶+ JET
PV/VP Fed-Zan SERIALNO.

MBT C-325 DEP¾i OUT

CA MyacMe DEPN W

caS Duragel TOTALFEET

RK Asphasol HRS

pH Max Get T/B/G

CAKE C325 WT. ON BIT

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)

%souDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP O ITA DEVLTION REDORD
Nik DESCRIPTION I.ENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmu

MAKE Nat Nat
MODEL SPSO 8PSD
srnoKE 8.50 8.50
LINER szza 6.25 6.25
SPM 0
GPM 0.00
sURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD
slow PUMP- SPM O O
SI.OW PUMP- PRES O O

AIR Drilling operationsdate DAILYWELLCOST $17,145
scm 0 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $205,175

U:y RODtpORiß.XLs BHA 1048.88 IEECTION RATE O CUMULATIVEWELLCOST (22

Marion Energy inc.
RECEIVED

Un &¶g, SEPO't2007

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
DAB.Y DRB.LING REPORT

uASEMM &WEU.ND. HRD Em

Ridge Runner 8-19 ClearCreak August 13, 2007
W NW MD MUMBER 00UNIY STR Mr ND.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 11
HERBENE R Ma ast. mz UGTAGEDRED IA570tSmG SizE,WElGHT, DE SEf@ aspat No.

40' 0 0 0 20" Line pipeconductor 40' . 11
ACTIVETMMEFORTTIME REFORTEDBY

Riqqing Up ( Prespud safety inspection. R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
REN-5 m TOGl.

15
TIME LC3i

MON TO HOURS Activity Detail
6 00 18:00 12.00 Rig up I Rig up front yardset catwalk and pipetub inove pusher shack and generatorto set piperacks.
18'00 6:00 12.00 Set dog hous steps Weld on gas buster and puthandrails on new stair hay platforrn,strap Bha and Une

up toolsto spud.

24.00
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS USED 3IT RECORD

DEWTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Dapp S12E

WEIGHT pa MFG

VlS Pac-R TYPE

Wi. Pol¶+ JET
PV/VP Fed-Zan SERIALNO.

MBT C-325 DEP¾i OUT

CA MyacMe DEPN W

caS Duragel TOTALFEET

RK Asphasol HRS

pH Max Get T/B/G

CAKE C325 WT. ON BIT

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)

%souDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP O ITA DEVLTION REDORD
Nik DESCRIPTION I.ENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmu

MAKE Nat Nat
MODEL SPSO 8PSD
srnoKE 8.50 8.50
LINER szza 6.25 6.25
SPM 0
GPM 0.00
sURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD
slow PUMP- SPM O O
SI.OW PUMP- PRES O O

AIR Drilling operationsdate DAILYWELLCOST $17,145
scm 0 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $205,175

U:y RODtpORiß.XLs BHA 1048.88 IEECTION RATE O CUMULATIVEWELLCOST (22

Marion Energy inc.
RECEIVED

Un &¶g, SEPO't2007

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
DAB.Y DRB.LING REPORT

uASEMM &WEU.ND. HRD Em

Ridge Runner 8-19 ClearCreak August 13, 2007
W NW MD MUMBER 00UNIY STR Mr ND.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 11
HERBENE R Ma ast. mz UGTAGEDRED IA570tSmG SizE,WElGHT, DE SEf@ aspat No.

40' 0 0 0 20" Line pipeconductor 40' . 11
ACTIVETMMEFORTTIME REFORTEDBY

Riqqing Up ( Prespud safety inspection. R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
REN-5 m TOGl.

15
TIME LC3i

MON TO HOURS Activity Detail
6 00 18:00 12.00 Rig up I Rig up front yardset catwalk and pipetub inove pusher shack and generatorto set piperacks.
18'00 6:00 12.00 Set dog hous steps Weld on gas buster and puthandrails on new stair hay platforrn,strap Bha and Une

up toolsto spud.

24.00
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS USED 3IT RECORD

DEWTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Dapp S12E

WEIGHT pa MFG

VlS Pac-R TYPE

Wi. Pol¶+ JET
PV/VP Fed-Zan SERIALNO.

MBT C-325 DEP¾i OUT

CA MyacMe DEPN W

caS Duragel TOTALFEET

RK Asphasol HRS

pH Max Get T/B/G

CAKE C325 WT. ON BIT

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)

%souDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP O ITA DEVLTION REDORD
Nik DESCRIPTION I.ENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmu

MAKE Nat Nat
MODEL SPSO 8PSD
srnoKE 8.50 8.50
LINER szza 6.25 6.25
SPM 0
GPM 0.00
sURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD
slow PUMP- SPM O O
SI.OW PUMP- PRES O O

AIR Drilling operationsdate DAILYWELLCOST $17,145
scm 0 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $205,175

U:y RODtpORiß.XLs BHA 1048.88 IEECTION RATE O CUMULATIVEWELLCOST (22



Marion Energy inc. RECElVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste SEPO4 2007

McKinney,Texas 75069

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
DAII..Y DRILLING REPORT

LEASEMME&WEL NO. HED DAFE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 12, 2007
RIG NME MD NUMBER ©UIRY ATE DAYNO.

UnitDrilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 10
TorALDUW M ma not.Ms FOUTAGEDIHRED STOtSHIG 512E,WEIŒT, GRADE SETO elurt No.

40' 0 0 0 |20"Line pipe conductor 40' 10
ACRVmrAf REFORTTDIE REPORTEDSY

Riqqing Upf preparingto Raise Mast R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
REMARRE

KBTOŒ.

15
TIMELO3

mon To nouns Activity Detail
6:00 Rigging Up IRaise Denick, Rig up rig floor,Set in air packageand rig it up Fillmud tanks and fresh water

18:00 12.00 Welder workingon Conductor head And surface flowline,finishingup K braces in sub structure.

18:00 6:00 12.00 Rig up tops, gasbuster lines and Adjust brakes, Fix lights on mud tanks, Slipand cut 60' drillline.

24.00
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED BIT RECORD

DEFIH NO. OF SACK5/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Depp SIZE

WEIGIT peo4)L MFG

VIS Pac-R TYPE

WL Poly+ JET

PVlYP
Fed-Zan SEIUALNO.

MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA Nyacide DEPHI IN

GELS Duragel TOTÆ FEET

AIK Asphasol HRS

pH Max Get T/B/G

CAKE C325 WT. ON BIT

CL DA1LYCOST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)

%souns alMum11vE COST $0.00 ANVEL

DRILLING ASSR4BLY PUMP D 4TA DEVI ITION REDORD

NO. DESCRIPrION I.ENGHi - PT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPWi 1NCLINATION / Aamuds

MAKE Nat Nat
MODEL SPSD SPSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINERSIzE 6.25 6.25
sPM 0
GPN 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD

SLOW PUMP•SPM 0 0
SLOW PUMP- PRES O Û

AIR Driling Og stadens data OAILYWELLCOST $17,145
scm 0 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $188r030

u:ynoumonts.xLS SHA 1048.88 IEECTION RATE CUMUMTIVEWELLCOST ]Ë

Marion Energy inc. RECElVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste SEPO4 2007

McKinney,Texas 75069

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
DAII..Y DRILLING REPORT

LEASEMME&WEL NO. HED DAFE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 12, 2007
RIG NME MD NUMBER ©UIRY ATE DAYNO.

UnitDrilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 10
TorALDUW M ma not.Ms FOUTAGEDIHRED STOtSHIG 512E,WEIŒT, GRADE SETO elurt No.

40' 0 0 0 |20"Line pipe conductor 40' 10
ACRVmrAf REFORTTDIE REPORTEDSY

Riqqing Upf preparingto Raise Mast R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
REMARRE

KBTOŒ.

15
TIMELO3

mon To nouns Activity Detail
6:00 Rigging Up IRaise Denick, Rig up rig floor,Set in air packageand rig it up Fillmud tanks and fresh water

18:00 12.00 Welder workingon Conductor head And surface flowline,finishingup K braces in sub structure.

18:00 6:00 12.00 Rig up tops, gasbuster lines and Adjust brakes, Fix lights on mud tanks, Slipand cut 60' drillline.

24.00
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED BIT RECORD

DEFIH NO. OF SACK5/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Depp SIZE

WEIGIT peo4)L MFG

VIS Pac-R TYPE

WL Poly+ JET

PVlYP
Fed-Zan SEIUALNO.

MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA Nyacide DEPHI IN

GELS Duragel TOTÆ FEET

AIK Asphasol HRS

pH Max Get T/B/G

CAKE C325 WT. ON BIT

CL DA1LYCOST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)

%souns alMum11vE COST $0.00 ANVEL

DRILLING ASSR4BLY PUMP D 4TA DEVI ITION REDORD

NO. DESCRIPrION I.ENGHi - PT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPWi 1NCLINATION / Aamuds

MAKE Nat Nat
MODEL SPSD SPSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINERSIzE 6.25 6.25
sPM 0
GPN 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD

SLOW PUMP•SPM 0 0
SLOW PUMP- PRES O Û

AIR Driling Og stadens data OAILYWELLCOST $17,145
scm 0 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $188r030

u:ynoumonts.xLS SHA 1048.88 IEECTION RATE CUMUMTIVEWELLCOST ]Ë



Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED

ÄcËn,"" 9 SEPO4 2007

DAn.Y ORn.uNG REPORT
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

LEASEMME&WEU.NO. RED DE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clearcreak August 11, 2007
RIGNME ANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE DAY80.

UnitDrillingCon. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 9
mra annu j u a. c.. a is. ( MDTAGEORRŒD MST CASUIGSE2E,WEIŒr, GMDE SET@ Reµmt &

40' | 0 0 | 0 20" Line pipe conductor 40' 9
KTWHYAr REPORT TDIE REPORTEDBY

Rigging Up / preparingto string up derrick ¡R.LTatman / Shiloh Williams
REMARIE KBTOGL

15
TIME LOG

mose To Houns Activity Detail
6•00 20:00 Rigging Up I String up Derrick, Run Electricalwires to lightplant,set in Pads house,Clean out pipetubs.

20:00 16.00 Weld On Stairs and hand rails thatwere modined for small location.

16.00
MUD 1ECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED BIT RECORD

DEPHI NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

7]ME Dapp SIZE

WEIGf T pac-UL MFG

VIS Pac-R TYPE

WI. Poly+ JET
PV/YP Fed-2an SERIALNO.

MBT C-325 DEFU OUT

CA MyacMe DEFU IN

GELS Duragel TOTALFEET

ALK Asphasal HRS

pH Max Get T/IVG

CAME C325 WT. ON BIT

CL DAR.YCOST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(f¢Ò
%souDS CUMULATIVECOST ‡0.00 ANVEL

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP D LTA DEVETION REDORD
MO. DESCREPTION LENGTN - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION I Azmuth

MAKE Nat Nat
MODEL SPSO BPSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM 0
GPM 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
Eco
SLOW PUMP- SPN O 0
SißW PUMP- PRES Û Û

AIR Drifmg Og arations data DA1LYWELLcosT $17,571
scm 0 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $170,458

U:\PROUglDALG.XLs BHA 1048.88 IEECHON RATE O CUMULATIVEWELLcosi

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED

ÄcËn,"" 9 SEPO4 2007

DAn.Y ORn.uNG REPORT
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

LEASEMME&WEU.NO. RED DE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clearcreak August 11, 2007
RIGNME ANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE DAY80.

UnitDrillingCon. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 9
mra annu j u a. c.. a is. ( MDTAGEORRŒD MST CASUIGSE2E,WEIŒr, GMDE SET@ Reµmt &

40' | 0 0 | 0 20" Line pipe conductor 40' 9
KTWHYAr REPORT TDIE REPORTEDBY

Rigging Up / preparingto string up derrick ¡R.LTatman / Shiloh Williams
REMARIE KBTOGL

15
TIME LOG

mose To Houns Activity Detail
6•00 20:00 Rigging Up I String up Derrick, Run Electricalwires to lightplant,set in Pads house,Clean out pipetubs.

20:00 16.00 Weld On Stairs and hand rails thatwere modined for small location.

16.00
MUD 1ECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED BIT RECORD

DEPHI NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

7]ME Dapp SIZE

WEIGf T pac-UL MFG

VIS Pac-R TYPE

WI. Poly+ JET
PV/YP Fed-2an SERIALNO.

MBT C-325 DEFU OUT

CA MyacMe DEFU IN

GELS Duragel TOTALFEET

ALK Asphasal HRS

pH Max Get T/IVG

CAME C325 WT. ON BIT

CL DAR.YCOST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(f¢Ò
%souDS CUMULATIVECOST ‡0.00 ANVEL

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP D LTA DEVETION REDORD
MO. DESCREPTION LENGTN - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION I Azmuth

MAKE Nat Nat
MODEL SPSO BPSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM 0
GPM 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
Eco
SLOW PUMP- SPN O 0
SißW PUMP- PRES Û Û

AIR Drifmg Og arations data DA1LYWELLcosT $17,571
scm 0 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $170,458

U:\PROUglDALG.XLs BHA 1048.88 IEECHON RATE O CUMULATIVEWELLcosi



Marion Energy inc. RECElVED
119 s Tennessee, ste SEPO4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DNTI i TNG REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
LMSEMME&WRLNŒ HRD DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak August 10, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE OAYMO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 8
vorALDEPM R&.ms AM.ns fDOTAGEORRED USTCASMGSizE,WEIGHT,GMDE SET@ RepatMo.

40' j 0 0 | 0 40' Conductor 40' 8
Acmstr«r RBuff TME REPORTEDBY

Riqqing Up / preparingto string up derrick ¡R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
RBiARES KBTOGL

15
TIME LC3

FRON TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 20 Rigging Up I Set in al major rig componants set in catwalk and co shack and pushers house,

20:00 16.00 Weld On

16.00
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED 31T RECORD

DEP1H NO. OF SACKS/LßS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Dapp S1ZE

WEIGif pac-UL MFG

VIS Pac-R TYPE

WL Poly+ JET

PV/YP Fed-Zan SERTALNO.

MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA MyacMe DEPTHIN

GSS Duragel TOTA1.FEET

ALK Asphasol HRS

pH Max Get T)B/G

CAKE C325 Wr. ON BIT

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP D 1TA DEVIATION REDORD
NA DESCRIPHON LÆNGTH- FT PUNP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth

MAKE Nat Ñat
MODEL SPSD SPSO
srRoKE 8.50 8.50
LINER $52E 6.25 6.25
sPM 0
GPM 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD

SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
SLOW PUMP- PRES Û Û

AIR Driing Operations data DAILYWELLcost $16,673
scm 0 PREVIOUSCUMcosT (153,785

U:\PROO RLG.Xiß BHA 1048.88 IEECTION RATE O CUMULATIVEWELLcosT

Marion Energy inc. RECElVED
119 s Tennessee, ste SEPO4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DNTI i TNG REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
LMSEMME&WRLNŒ HRD DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak August 10, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE OAYMO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 8
vorALDEPM R&.ms AM.ns fDOTAGEORRED USTCASMGSizE,WEIGHT,GMDE SET@ RepatMo.

40' j 0 0 | 0 40' Conductor 40' 8
Acmstr«r RBuff TME REPORTEDBY

Riqqing Up / preparingto string up derrick ¡R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
RBiARES KBTOGL

15
TIME LC3

FRON TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 20 Rigging Up I Set in al major rig componants set in catwalk and co shack and pushers house,

20:00 16.00 Weld On

16.00
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED 31T RECORD

DEP1H NO. OF SACKS/LßS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Dapp S1ZE

WEIGif pac-UL MFG

VIS Pac-R TYPE

WL Poly+ JET

PV/YP Fed-Zan SERTALNO.

MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA MyacMe DEPTHIN

GSS Duragel TOTA1.FEET

ALK Asphasol HRS

pH Max Get T)B/G

CAKE C325 Wr. ON BIT

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)

%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP D 1TA DEVIATION REDORD
NA DESCRIPHON LÆNGTH- FT PUNP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth

MAKE Nat Ñat
MODEL SPSD SPSO
srRoKE 8.50 8.50
LINER $52E 6.25 6.25
sPM 0
GPM 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD

SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
SLOW PUMP- PRES Û Û

AIR Driing Operations data DAILYWELLcost $16,673
scm 0 PREVIOUSCUMcosT (153,785

U:\PROO RLG.Xiß BHA 1048.88 IEECTION RATE O CUMULATIVEWELLcosT

Marion Energy inc. RECElVED
119 s Tennessee, ste SEPO4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DNTI i TNG REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
LMSEMME&WRLNŒ HRD DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak August 10, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE OAYMO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 8
vorALDEPM R&.ms AM.ns fDOTAGEORRED USTCASMGSizE,WEIGHT,GMDE SET@ RepatMo.

40' j 0 0 | 0 40' Conductor 40' 8
Acmstr«r RBuff TME REPORTEDBY

Riqqing Up / preparingto string up derrick ¡R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
RBiARES KBTOGL

15
TIME LC3

FRON TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 20 Rigging Up I Set in al major rig componants set in catwalk and co shack and pushers house,

20:00 16.00 Weld On

16.00
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED 31T RECORD

DEP1H NO. OF SACKS/LßS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Dapp S1ZE

WEIGif pac-UL MFG

VIS Pac-R TYPE

WL Poly+ JET

PV/YP Fed-Zan SERTALNO.

MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA MyacMe DEPTHIN

GSS Duragel TOTA1.FEET

ALK Asphasol HRS

pH Max Get T)B/G

CAKE C325 Wr. ON BIT

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)

%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP D 1TA DEVIATION REDORD
NA DESCRIPHON LÆNGTH- FT PUNP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth

MAKE Nat Ñat
MODEL SPSD SPSO
srRoKE 8.50 8.50
LINER $52E 6.25 6.25
sPM 0
GPM 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD

SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
SLOW PUMP- PRES Û Û

AIR Driing Operations data DAILYWELLcost $16,673
scm 0 PREVIOUSCUMcosT (153,785

U:\PROO RLG.Xiß BHA 1048.88 IEECTION RATE O CUMULATIVEWELLcosT



Marion Energy inc.
RECEIVED

Ån ,""exa g, SEPO4 2007

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING
DAII.Y DRILI.ING REPORT

LMSEMME&WELR BRD DME

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clearcreak August 9, 2007
MGMMEMIDIKMBSt COUNTY STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 carbon Utah 7
TOTÆÐEPM Mas M¾s fDDTAGEORURD (ASTŒSHIGSŒ,WBGHT,GMDE SETO Repath

40' 0 0 0 \40'Conductor 40' 7
ACTIWIfATREPORT791E REFORTEDBY

Breaking Down Rig C.E.Crow/ R.M.Crow
REMAMS KBTOGL

15
TIME I.O 2

FRON TO HOURS Activity Detsii
640 20:00 Rigging Up IClean Rig With Steam Cleanerl Rig Up Pits/ Pumps/ Ught Plant & Fuel Tank

20:00 16.00 Weld On MattingBoartis
20 00 6:00 8.00 Wait On Daylight

24.00
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED RIT RECORD

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

T&lE Dapp SIZE

WEfGHT pec-UL MFG

VIS Pac-R TYPE

WL Poly+ JET

Pv/vP I;ed-2nn SERTALNO.

MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA Myacue DEPTHDI

GELS Duragel TOTALFEET

ALK Asphasoi HRS

pH Max Get T/B/G

CAWE C325 WT. ON BIT

CL DA1LYG35T $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)

%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST ‡0.00 ANVEL

DRIllING ASSE 48LY PUMP D 1TA DEVIATION REWRD
NCA DESCREPflON INGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTN INCLINATION / Azmuth

MAKE Nat Nat
MODEL SPSO 8PSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
spn 0
GPM 0.00
SURFPRESSURE 0.0
ECD
SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
SmW PUMP- PRes O O

AIR Drilling Operations data DAILYWELLCOST $17,842
SCFM Û PREVIOUSCUMOST $135,944

U:VRODV¾¾tLG.XLs BHA 1048.88 IluscrioN RATE O CUMULATIVEWELLCOST

Marion Energy inc.
RECEIVED

Ån ,""exa g, SEPO4 2007

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING
DAII.Y DRILI.ING REPORT

LMSEMME&WELR BRD DME

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clearcreak August 9, 2007
MGMMEMIDIKMBSt COUNTY STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 carbon Utah 7
TOTÆÐEPM Mas M¾s fDDTAGEORURD (ASTŒSHIGSŒ,WBGHT,GMDE SETO Repath

40' 0 0 0 \40'Conductor 40' 7
ACTIWIfATREPORT791E REFORTEDBY

Breaking Down Rig C.E.Crow/ R.M.Crow
REMAMS KBTOGL

15
TIME I.O 2

FRON TO HOURS Activity Detsii
640 20:00 Rigging Up IClean Rig With Steam Cleanerl Rig Up Pits/ Pumps/ Ught Plant & Fuel Tank

20:00 16.00 Weld On MattingBoartis
20 00 6:00 8.00 Wait On Daylight

24.00
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED RIT RECORD

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

T&lE Dapp SIZE

WEfGHT pec-UL MFG

VIS Pac-R TYPE

WL Poly+ JET

Pv/vP I;ed-2nn SERTALNO.

MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA Myacue DEPTHDI

GELS Duragel TOTALFEET

ALK Asphasoi HRS

pH Max Get T/B/G

CAWE C325 WT. ON BIT

CL DA1LYG35T $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)

%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST ‡0.00 ANVEL

DRIllING ASSE 48LY PUMP D 1TA DEVIATION REWRD

NCA DESCREPflON INGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTN INCLINATION / Azmuth

MAKE Nat Nat
MODEL SPSO 8PSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
spn 0
GPM 0.00
SURFPRESSURE 0.0
ECD

SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
SmW PUMP- PRes O O

AIR Drilling Operations data DAILYWELLCOST $17,842
SCFM Û PREVIOUSCUMOST $135,944

U:VRODV¾¾tLG.XLs BHA 1048.88 IluscrioN RATE O CUMULATIVEWELLCOST

Marion Energy inc.
RECEIVED

Ån ,""exa g, SEPO4 2007

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING
DAII.Y DRILI.ING REPORT

LMSEMME&WELR BRD DME

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clearcreak August 9, 2007
MGMMEMIDIKMBSt COUNTY STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 carbon Utah 7
TOTÆÐEPM Mas M¾s fDDTAGEORURD (ASTŒSHIGSŒ,WBGHT,GMDE SETO Repath

40' 0 0 0 \40'Conductor 40' 7
ACTIWIfATREPORT791E REFORTEDBY

Breaking Down Rig C.E.Crow/ R.M.Crow
REMAMS KBTOGL

15
TIME I.O 2

FRON TO HOURS Activity Detsii
640 20:00 Rigging Up IClean Rig With Steam Cleanerl Rig Up Pits/ Pumps/ Ught Plant & Fuel Tank

20:00 16.00 Weld On MattingBoartis
20 00 6:00 8.00 Wait On Daylight

24.00
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED RIT RECORD

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

T&lE Dapp SIZE

WEfGHT pec-UL MFG

VIS Pac-R TYPE

WL Poly+ JET

Pv/vP I;ed-2nn SERTALNO.

MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA Myacue DEPTHDI

GELS Duragel TOTALFEET

ALK Asphasoi HRS

pH Max Get T/B/G

CAWE C325 WT. ON BIT

CL DA1LYG35T $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)

%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST ‡0.00 ANVEL

DRIllING ASSE 48LY PUMP D 1TA DEVIATION REWRD

NCA DESCREPflON INGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTN INCLINATION / Azmuth

MAKE Nat Nat
MODEL SPSO 8PSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
spn 0
GPM 0.00
SURFPRESSURE 0.0
ECD

SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
SmW PUMP- PRes O O

AIR Drilling Operations data DAILYWELLCOST $17,842
SCFM Û PREVIOUSCUMOST $135,944

U:VRODV¾¾tLG.XLs BHA 1048.88 IluscrioN RATE O CUMULATIVEWELLCOST



RECEIVEDMarion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste SEPOIl 2007

McKinney,Texas 75069
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
ASEMMERWEL ND, HRD DAŒ

Ridge Runner8-19 Clear Creak August 8, 2007
MGMAMEANDNUMBER COUR STE DAY NO.

Unit DrillingCor ). Rig 132 Carbon Utah 6
TUTALDEN At Mm man AR mz fDUTAGEÐ¾ŒED MSTCASMG 512E,WBGRT, GADE SETO Repst No.

40' 0 0 0 40' Conductor 40' 6
ACTIWWMMEPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Breaking Down Rig C.E. Crow/ R.M.Crow
REMARIS KBTOGL

15
TIME LO3

FRON TO HOURS ACSVity Detail
6 Rigging Down& RiggingUp/Clean Rig With Steam Cleanerl Pin Sub And Level Same/ Set Denick

20:00 16.00 On FloorISet Up Water Tank/ Set Entire Rig On PlasticlWeld MattingBoards
20 OD 6:00 8.00

24.00
MUD lECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED SIT RECORD

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Dapp SEE

WEKRIT paeUL MFG

VIS Pac-R TYPE

WL Poly+ JET
PV/YP fabZan SERIALNO.

MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA MyacMe DEVMIN

GELS Duragel TOTALFEET

ALK Asphasal HRS

pH Max Get T/B/G

CAME C325 WT. ON BIT

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)

%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0,00 ANVEL

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP D TA DEVIATION REDORD
NOW DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth

MAKE Nat Nat
MoDEL SPSO 8PSD
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINERSIzE 6.25 6.25
sPM 0
GPM 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD
SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
SIDW PUMP- PRES Û Û

AIR Dreung operationsdata DAILYWELLCOST $19,762
scm 0 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $116,182

U:VRODWRLG.XLs BHA 1048.88 IN3ECTION RATE Û CUMULATIVEWELLCOST

RECEIVEDMarion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste SEPOIl 2007

McKinney,Texas 75069
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
ASEMMERWEL ND, HRD DAŒ

Ridge Runner8-19 Clear Creak August 8, 2007
MGMAMEANDNUMBER COUR STE DAY NO.

Unit DrillingCor ). Rig 132 Carbon Utah 6
TUTALDEN At Mm man AR mz fDUTAGEÐ¾ŒED MSTCASMG 512E,WBGRT, GADE SETO Repst No.

40' 0 0 0 40' Conductor 40' 6
ACTIWWMMEPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Breaking Down Rig C.E. Crow/ R.M.Crow
REMARIS KBTOGL

15
TIME LO3

FRON TO HOURS ACSVity Detail
6 Rigging Down& RiggingUp/Clean Rig With Steam Cleanerl Pin Sub And Level Same/ Set Denick

20:00 16.00 On FloorISet Up Water Tank/ Set Entire Rig On PlasticlWeld MattingBoards
20 OD 6:00 8.00

24.00
MUD lECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED SIT RECORD

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Dapp SEE

WEKRIT paeUL MFG

VIS Pac-R TYPE

WL Poly+ JET
PV/YP fabZan SERIALNO.

MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA MyacMe DEVMIN

GELS Duragel TOTALFEET

ALK Asphasal HRS

pH Max Get T/B/G

CAME C325 WT. ON BIT

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)

%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0,00 ANVEL

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP D TA DEVIATION REDORD
NOW DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth

MAKE Nat Nat
MoDEL SPSO 8PSD
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINERSIzE 6.25 6.25
sPM 0
GPM 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD

SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
SIDW PUMP- PRES Û Û

AIR Dreung operationsdata DAILYWELLCOST $19,762
scm 0 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $116,182

U:VRODWRLG.XLs BHA 1048.88 IN3ECTION RATE Û CUMULATIVEWELLCOST

RECEIVEDMarion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste SEPOIl 2007

McKinney,Texas 75069
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
ASEMMERWEL ND, HRD DAŒ

Ridge Runner8-19 Clear Creak August 8, 2007
MGMAMEANDNUMBER COUR STE DAY NO.

Unit DrillingCor ). Rig 132 Carbon Utah 6
TUTALDEN At Mm man AR mz fDUTAGEÐ¾ŒED MSTCASMG 512E,WBGRT, GADE SETO Repst No.

40' 0 0 0 40' Conductor 40' 6
ACTIWWMMEPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Breaking Down Rig C.E. Crow/ R.M.Crow
REMARIS KBTOGL

15
TIME LO3

FRON TO HOURS ACSVity Detail
6 Rigging Down& RiggingUp/Clean Rig With Steam Cleanerl Pin Sub And Level Same/ Set Denick

20:00 16.00 On FloorISet Up Water Tank/ Set Entire Rig On PlasticlWeld MattingBoards
20 OD 6:00 8.00

24.00
MUD lECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED SIT RECORD

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Dapp SEE

WEKRIT paeUL MFG

VIS Pac-R TYPE

WL Poly+ JET
PV/YP fabZan SERIALNO.

MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA MyacMe DEVMIN

GELS Duragel TOTALFEET

ALK Asphasal HRS

pH Max Get T/B/G

CAME C325 WT. ON BIT

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)

%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0,00 ANVEL

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP D TA DEVIATION REDORD
NOW DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth

MAKE Nat Nat
MoDEL SPSO 8PSD
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINERSIzE 6.25 6.25
sPM 0
GPM 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD

SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
SIDW PUMP- PRES Û Û

AIR Dreung operationsdata DAILYWELLCOST $19,762
scm 0 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $116,182

U:VRODWRLG.XLs BHA 1048.88 IN3ECTION RATE Û CUMULATIVEWELLCOST



Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069 SEPO4 2007

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING
tBSE MAMER WRL NO. HHD MIE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak August 7, 2007
MGNMIEANDMUMBER 00UNIY STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 5
TOTALOBWN Re &s at Hm NOTH OMED tASTCASHIG52E, WBŒT, GRADE SETO RepetNo.

40' 0 0 | 0 |40'Conductor 40' 5
ACilWITATREPORTTDIE REFORTEDBY

Breaking Down Rig C.E. Crow/ R.M.Crow
REMARKS KBTOG.

15
TIME LD]i

MON TO HOURS ACliVity Detail
6'00 Rigging Down/Clean Rig With Steam Cleaner/ Received Okay To MoveOnto Location

20:00 16.00 Move Derrick & HalfOf Sub Onto Location/WeldMattingBoards
20 00 6:00 8.00

24.00
MUD lECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED 31T RECORD

DEPIN NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.
TIME Dapp SIZE

WEIGHT pa MFG

VIS Pack TYPE
WL Poly+ JET

Pv/vP Bed-Zan SERIALNO.

MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT
CA MyacMe DEFIH IN

GELS Duragel TOTALFEET
ALK Asphasol HRS
pH Max Get T/B/G
CAME C325 WT. ON Bir
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM
DAPP PREVIOUSCOET ROP(fph)
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL

DRILLIMG ASSE 4BLY PUMP D iTA DEVIATION REDORD
an DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPf¾ INCLINATION / Azmuth

MAKE Nat Nat
#40DEL SPBÛ SPBÛ
STROKE 8.50 8.50
L2NERSXzE 6.25 6.25
SPM 0
GPM 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD

SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
SLOW PUMP- PRES Û Û

AIR DrHing Operations data DAILYWEU. COST $36,354
scm 0 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $79,828

u:ynootponts.xts BHA 1048.88 ImECTION RATE 0 CUMULATIVEWELLCOST

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069 SEPO4 2007

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING
tBSE MAMER WRL NO. HHD MIE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak August 7, 2007
MGNMIEANDMUMBER 00UNIY STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 5
TOTALOBWN Re &s at Hm NOTH OMED tASTCASHIG52E, WBŒT, GRADE SETO RepetNo.

40' 0 0 | 0 |40'Conductor 40' 5
ACilWITATREPORTTDIE REFORTEDBY

Breaking Down Rig C.E. Crow/ R.M.Crow
REMARKS KBTOG.

15
TIME LD]i

MON TO HOURS ACliVity Detail
6'00 Rigging Down/Clean Rig With Steam Cleaner/ Received Okay To MoveOnto Location

20:00 16.00 Move Derrick & HalfOf Sub Onto Location/WeldMattingBoards
20 00 6:00 8.00

24.00
MUD lECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED 31T RECORD

DEPIN NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Dapp SIZE

WEIGHT pa MFG

VIS Pack TYPE

WL Poly+ JET

Pv/vP Bed-Zan SERIALNO.

MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA MyacMe DEFIH IN

GELS Duragel TOTALFEET

ALK Asphasol HRS

pH Max Get T/B/G

CAME C325 WT. ON Bir

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOET ROP(fph)
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL

DRILLIMG ASSE 4BLY PUMP D iTA DEVIATION REDORD
an DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPf¾ INCLINATION / Azmuth

MAKE Nat Nat
#40DEL SPBÛ SPBÛ
STROKE 8.50 8.50
L2NERSXzE 6.25 6.25
SPM 0
GPM 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD

SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
SLOW PUMP- PRES Û Û

AIR DrHing Operations data DAILYWEU. COST $36,354
scm 0 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $79,828

u:ynootponts.xts BHA 1048.88 ImECTION RATE 0 CUMULATIVEWELLCOST

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069 SEPO4 2007

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING
tBSE MAMER WRL NO. HHD MIE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak August 7, 2007
MGNMIEANDMUMBER 00UNIY STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 5
TOTALOBWN Re &s at Hm NOTH OMED tASTCASHIG52E, WBŒT, GRADE SETO RepetNo.

40' 0 0 | 0 |40'Conductor 40' 5
ACilWITATREPORTTDIE REFORTEDBY

Breaking Down Rig C.E. Crow/ R.M.Crow
REMARKS KBTOG.

15
TIME LD]i

MON TO HOURS ACliVity Detail
6'00 Rigging Down/Clean Rig With Steam Cleaner/ Received Okay To MoveOnto Location

20:00 16.00 Move Derrick & HalfOf Sub Onto Location/WeldMattingBoards
20 00 6:00 8.00

24.00
MUD lECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED 31T RECORD

DEPIN NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Dapp SIZE

WEIGHT pa MFG

VIS Pack TYPE

WL Poly+ JET

Pv/vP Bed-Zan SERIALNO.

MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA MyacMe DEFIH IN

GELS Duragel TOTALFEET

ALK Asphasol HRS

pH Max Get T/B/G

CAME C325 WT. ON Bir

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOET ROP(fph)
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL

DRILLIMG ASSE 4BLY PUMP D iTA DEVIATION REDORD
an DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPf¾ INCLINATION / Azmuth

MAKE Nat Nat
#40DEL SPBÛ SPBÛ
STROKE 8.50 8.50
L2NERSXzE 6.25 6.25
SPM 0
GPM 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD

SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
SLOW PUMP- PRES Û Û

AIR DrHing Operations data DAILYWEU. COST $36,354
scm 0 PREVIOUSCUMCOST $79,828

u:ynootponts.xts BHA 1048.88 ImECTION RATE 0 CUMULATIVEWELLCOST



Marion Energy inc.
RECEIVED

Àcing""ig, SEPO4 2007

OtVOFOIL,GAS&MINING
DAB.Y DRTI i TNG REPORT

ASEMANERWRI. NO. HED OR

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak August 6, 2007
RIGNMIEMIDIKMBER COUNiY STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 carbon Utah 4
RML DBWH M. &s Rot. ms FOUTMEORiuED MSTCASSIG SIZE,WEIGHT, GRADE SETO No.

40' 0 0 0 40' Conductor 40' 4
mrwarfAf SEFORTTWE REFOWEBBY

Breaking Down Rig ¡C.E.Crow/ R.M.Crow
namins KBTOGL

\ 15
TIME LC3

mon To Houns Activity Detail
6 00 0.00 Rigging Down/CleanRig With Steam Cleanerl MovePits, Catwalk, & Dog House Up Mountain

20:00 16.00 Weld On MattingBoards
20 00 6:00 8.00

24.00
MUD lECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED 3IT RECORD

DEPHI NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

EME Dapp SIZE

WEIŒf pac-UL MFG

VIS Pac-R WPE

WL Poir+ JET
PV/YP Fed-Zan SERIALNO.

MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA Myacide DEPTHM
GRS Duragel TOTALFEET

ALK Asphasol HRS

pH Max Get T/B/G

CAxE C325 WT. ON BIT

CL DA1LYCOST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)

%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL

DRIt.I.IMG ASSE 1BLY PUMP D iTA DEVIATION RE RD
MA DESCRIPTION UNGTN - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPHI INCLINATION I Axmuth

MAKE Nat Nat
MGDEL SPSO 8PSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIžE 6.25 6.25
SPM 0
GPM 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD
SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
stow PUMP- PRES O O

AIR DrHing Operations data DAILYWELLCOST $16,673
scm 0 PREVIDUSCUMcost $63,155

U:\PRODyx)RLß.XLS BHA 1048.88 IEECTION RATE O CUMULATIVEWEu.cost

Marion Energy inc.
RECEIVED

Àcing""ig, SEPO4 2007

OtVOFOIL,GAS&MINING
DAB.Y DRTI i TNG REPORT

ASEMANERWRI. NO. HED OR

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak August 6, 2007
RIGNMIEMIDIKMBER COUNiY STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 carbon Utah 4
RML DBWH M. &s Rot. ms FOUTMEORiuED MSTCASSIG SIZE,WEIGHT, GRADE SETO No.

40' 0 0 0 40' Conductor 40' 4
mrwarfAf SEFORTTWE REFOWEBBY

Breaking Down Rig ¡C.E.Crow/ R.M.Crow
namins KBTOGL

\ 15
TIME LC3

mon To Houns Activity Detail
6 00 0.00 Rigging Down/CleanRig With Steam Cleanerl MovePits, Catwalk, & Dog House Up Mountain

20:00 16.00 Weld On MattingBoards
20 00 6:00 8.00

24.00
MUD lECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED 3IT RECORD

DEPHI NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

EME Dapp SIZE

WEIŒf pac-UL MFG

VIS Pac-R WPE

WL Poir+ JET
PV/YP Fed-Zan SERIALNO.

MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA Myacide DEPTHM
GRS Duragel TOTALFEET

ALK Asphasol HRS

pH Max Get T/B/G

CAxE C325 WT. ON BIT

CL DA1LYCOST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)

%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL

DRIt.I.IMG ASSE 1BLY PUMP D iTA DEVIATION RE RD
MA DESCRIPTION UNGTN - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPHI INCLINATION I Axmuth

MAKE Nat Nat
MGDEL SPSO 8PSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIžE 6.25 6.25
SPM 0
GPM 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD

SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
stow PUMP- PRES O O

AIR DrHing Operations data DAILYWELLCOST $16,673
scm 0 PREVIDUSCUMcost $63,155

U:\PRODyx)RLß.XLS BHA 1048.88 IEECTION RATE O CUMULATIVEWEu.cost

Marion Energy inc.
RECEIVED

Àcing""ig, SEPO4 2007

OtVOFOIL,GAS&MINING
DAB.Y DRTI i TNG REPORT

ASEMANERWRI. NO. HED OR

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak August 6, 2007
RIGNMIEMIDIKMBER COUNiY STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 carbon Utah 4
RML DBWH M. &s Rot. ms FOUTMEORiuED MSTCASSIG SIZE,WEIGHT, GRADE SETO No.

40' 0 0 0 40' Conductor 40' 4
mrwarfAf SEFORTTWE REFOWEBBY

Breaking Down Rig ¡C.E.Crow/ R.M.Crow
namins KBTOGL

\ 15
TIME LC3

mon To Houns Activity Detail
6 00 0.00 Rigging Down/CleanRig With Steam Cleanerl MovePits, Catwalk, & Dog House Up Mountain

20:00 16.00 Weld On MattingBoards
20 00 6:00 8.00

24.00
MUD lECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED 3IT RECORD

DEPHI NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

EME Dapp SIZE

WEIŒf pac-UL MFG

VIS Pac-R WPE

WL Poir+ JET
PV/YP Fed-Zan SERIALNO.

MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA Myacide DEPTHM
GRS Duragel TOTALFEET

ALK Asphasol HRS

pH Max Get T/B/G

CAxE C325 WT. ON BIT

CL DA1LYCOST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)

%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL

DRIt.I.IMG ASSE 1BLY PUMP D iTA DEVIATION RE RD
MA DESCRIPTION UNGTN - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPHI INCLINATION I Axmuth

MAKE Nat Nat
MGDEL SPSO 8PSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIžE 6.25 6.25
SPM 0
GPM 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD

SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
stow PUMP- PRES O O

AIR DrHing Operations data DAILYWELLCOST $16,673
scm 0 PREVIDUSCUMcost $63,155

U:\PRODyx)RLß.XLS BHA 1048.88 IEECTION RATE O CUMULATIVEWEu.cost



Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste

MclGnney,Tens 75069 SEP0 4 2007

DAILY DRIO.ING REPORT DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING
MASEMAMEaWERNO. flEID DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 5, 2007
RIGNANEMIDMUMBER COUNTY STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling Cor). Rig 132 carbon Utah 3
TOTALDEPM AM. He aun an. Ns UGTAGEORiuED tA5f CASMG 512E,WBGE, GRADE SETO AmpcutNo.

40' | 0 0 j 0 40' Conductor 40' 3
ACTIVHYMREFORTTWE REPORTEDBY

Breaking Down Rig C.E. Crow/ R.M.Crow
REMARis KBTOGL

15
TIME LOG

FRON TO HOURS Acti¥ig Detail
6:00 20:00 16.00 Rigging Down/CleanRig With Steam Cleaner/ Start Staging Rig On Mountain/WeldMattign Boards
20% 6:00 8.00 Waiting On Daylight

24.00
MUD lECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED BIT RECORD

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Dopp SIZE
WEIGHT pac-UL MFC

VlS M TYPE

WL Poly+ RT
PV/YP Fed-Zan SERIALNO.

MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA Myadde DEPTNIN

GEIS Duragel TOTAt.FEET
ALX Asphasol HRS

pH Max Gel T/B/G

CAME C325 WF, ON BIT
CL DAILY(X)ST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP D LTA DEVIATION RECORD
MIL DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPHI INCLINATION/ Aamuth

MAKE Nat Nat
SiODEL SPSO 8PSD
sTRoKE 8.50 8.50
LINER $22E 6.25 6.25
sPM 0
GPM 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD
SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
SLOWPUMP-PRES Û Û

AIR odang operadensdata DA1LYWELLCOST $16,673
sem 0 PREVIDUSCUMCOST >,48Ž

U: RODg)DRLG.XLs BHA 1048.88 IWECilON RATE Û CUMUIATIVEWELLcosT

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste

MclGnney,Tens 75069 SEP0 4 2007

DAILY DRIO.ING REPORT DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING
MASEMAMEaWERNO. flEID DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 5, 2007
RIGNANEMIDMUMBER COUNTY STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling Cor). Rig 132 carbon Utah 3
TOTALDEPM AM. He aun an. Ns UGTAGEORiuED tA5f CASMG 512E,WBGE, GRADE SETO AmpcutNo.

40' | 0 0 j 0 40' Conductor 40' 3
ACTIVHYMREFORTTWE REPORTEDBY

Breaking Down Rig C.E. Crow/ R.M.Crow
REMARis KBTOGL

15
TIME LOG

FRON TO HOURS Acti¥ig Detail
6:00 20:00 16.00 Rigging Down/CleanRig With Steam Cleaner/ Start Staging Rig On Mountain/WeldMattign Boards
20% 6:00 8.00 Waiting On Daylight

24.00
MUD lECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED BIT RECORD

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Dopp SIZE

WEIGHT pac-UL MFC

VlS M TYPE

WL Poly+ RT
PV/YP Fed-Zan SERIALNO.

MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA Myadde DEPTNIN

GEIS Duragel TOTAt.FEET

ALX Asphasol HRS

pH Max Gel T/B/G

CAME C325 WF, ON BIT

CL DAILY(X)ST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP D LTA DEVIATION RECORD
MIL DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPHI INCLINATION/ Aamuth

MAKE Nat Nat
SiODEL SPSO 8PSD
sTRoKE 8.50 8.50
LINER $22E 6.25 6.25
sPM 0
GPM 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD

SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
SLOWPUMP-PRES Û Û

AIR odang operadensdata DA1LYWELLCOST $16,673
sem 0 PREVIDUSCUMCOST >,48Ž

U: RODg)DRLG.XLs BHA 1048.88 IWECilON RATE Û CUMUIATIVEWELLcosT

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste

MclGnney,Tens 75069 SEP0 4 2007

DAILY DRIO.ING REPORT DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING
MASEMAMEaWERNO. flEID DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak August 5, 2007
RIGNANEMIDMUMBER COUNTY STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling Cor). Rig 132 carbon Utah 3
TOTALDEPM AM. He aun an. Ns UGTAGEORiuED tA5f CASMG 512E,WBGE, GRADE SETO AmpcutNo.

40' | 0 0 j 0 40' Conductor 40' 3
ACTIVHYMREFORTTWE REPORTEDBY

Breaking Down Rig C.E. Crow/ R.M.Crow
REMARis KBTOGL

15
TIME LOG

FRON TO HOURS Acti¥ig Detail
6:00 20:00 16.00 Rigging Down/CleanRig With Steam Cleaner/ Start Staging Rig On Mountain/WeldMattign Boards
20% 6:00 8.00 Waiting On Daylight

24.00
MUD lECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED BIT RECORD

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Dopp SIZE

WEIGHT pac-UL MFC

VlS M TYPE

WL Poly+ RT
PV/YP Fed-Zan SERIALNO.

MBT C-325 DEPTHOUT

CA Myadde DEPTNIN

GEIS Duragel TOTAt.FEET

ALX Asphasol HRS

pH Max Gel T/B/G

CAME C325 WF, ON BIT

CL DAILY(X)ST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP D LTA DEVIATION RECORD
MIL DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPHI INCLINATION/ Aamuth

MAKE Nat Nat
SiODEL SPSO 8PSD
sTRoKE 8.50 8.50
LINER $22E 6.25 6.25
sPM 0
GPM 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD

SLOW PUMP- SPM 0 0
SLOWPUMP-PRES Û Û

AIR odang operadensdata DA1LYWELLCOST $16,673
sem 0 PREVIDUSCUMCOST >,48Ž

U: RODg)DRLG.XLs BHA 1048.88 IWECilON RATE Û CUMUIATIVEWELLcosT



Marion Energy inc. RECElVED
119 S Tennessee Ste

McKinney,Texas #5069 SEPO4 2007

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
ŒASEMME&WEL NO. HED DE

Ridge Runner 8-19 ClearCreak August 4, 2007
RIGNMEMDNUMBER COUWfY STR OMNO.

UnitDrilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 2
Tormeenu non. an.a. MUTAGEDRRED METCASMGSRWEIGHT,GRADE SEf@ ReisrtMo.

40' | 0 0 0 40' Conductor 40' 2
ACilvBTE REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Breaking Down Rig C.E. Cow/ R.M.Crow
REMRis KBTOŒ.

15
TIME 003

mon TO HOURs Activity Detail
6 00 0.00 Rigging Dom/ Received Orders To Clean ARMud, Grease, And DirtOffAIIEquipment

20:00 2.00 BuildMattingBoards
20 00 6•00 10.00 Wait On Daylight

12.00
MUD 3ECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED RIT RECORD

DEFTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TlME Dapp SI2E

wEleur pac-UL MFC

Y]S Pac-R TYPE
Poly+ -lET

PV/TP Fed-Zan SERIALNO.

MET C-325 DEVfHOUT

CA Myacide DEPN IN

GEIS Duragel TOTALFEET

AUC Asphasol HRS

pH Max Gei T/B/G

CAME C325 WT. ON BIT

CL DAILYCOST 10.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)
%80005 CUMUMT1VECOST $0.00 AN VEL

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP D iTA DEVIATION RTMRD
NŒ DESCRIPFION LENGM - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Aamuth

MAKE Nat ÑBt
NODEL SPSO 8PSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
sPM Û
GPM 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD

SLOWPUMP- SPN O 0
SLOWPUMP•PRES Û Û

AIR DrMing Operations data DAlLYWELI.cost $21,959
scm 0 PREVIOUSUM COST $24,523

U: DALG.XLS SHA 1048.88 IEECilON RATE Û ŒMURTIVE WELLCOST

Marion Energy inc. RECElVED
119 S Tennessee Ste

McKinney,Texas #5069 SEPO4 2007

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
ŒASEMME&WEL NO. HED DE

Ridge Runner 8-19 ClearCreak August 4, 2007
RIGNMEMDNUMBER COUWfY STR OMNO.

UnitDrilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 2
Tormeenu non. an.a. MUTAGEDRRED METCASMGSRWEIGHT,GRADE SEf@ ReisrtMo.

40' | 0 0 0 40' Conductor 40' 2
ACilvBTE REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Breaking Down Rig C.E. Cow/ R.M.Crow
REMRis KBTOŒ.

15
TIME 003

mon TO HOURs Activity Detail
6 00 0.00 Rigging Dom/ Received Orders To Clean ARMud, Grease, And DirtOffAIIEquipment

20:00 2.00 BuildMattingBoards
20 00 6•00 10.00 Wait On Daylight

12.00
MUD 3ECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED RIT RECORD

DEFTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TlME Dapp SI2E

wEleur pac-UL MFC

Y]S Pac-R TYPE
Poly+ -lET

PV/TP Fed-Zan SERIALNO.

MET C-325 DEVfHOUT

CA Myacide DEPN IN

GEIS Duragel TOTALFEET

AUC Asphasol HRS

pH Max Gei T/B/G

CAME C325 WT. ON BIT

CL DAILYCOST 10.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)
%80005 CUMUMT1VECOST $0.00 AN VEL

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP D iTA DEVIATION RTMRD
NŒ DESCRIPFION LENGM - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Aamuth

MAKE Nat ÑBt

NODEL SPSO 8PSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
sPM Û
GPM 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD

SLOWPUMP- SPN O 0
SLOWPUMP•PRES Û Û

AIR DrMing Operations data DAlLYWELI.cost $21,959
scm 0 PREVIOUSUM COST $24,523

U: DALG.XLS SHA 1048.88 IEECilON RATE Û ŒMURTIVE WELLCOST

Marion Energy inc. RECElVED
119 S Tennessee Ste

McKinney,Texas #5069 SEPO4 2007

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
ŒASEMME&WEL NO. HED DE

Ridge Runner 8-19 ClearCreak August 4, 2007
RIGNMEMDNUMBER COUWfY STR OMNO.

UnitDrilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 2
Tormeenu non. an.a. MUTAGEDRRED METCASMGSRWEIGHT,GRADE SEf@ ReisrtMo.

40' | 0 0 0 40' Conductor 40' 2
ACilvBTE REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Breaking Down Rig C.E. Cow/ R.M.Crow
REMRis KBTOŒ.

15
TIME 003

mon TO HOURs Activity Detail
6 00 0.00 Rigging Dom/ Received Orders To Clean ARMud, Grease, And DirtOffAIIEquipment

20:00 2.00 BuildMattingBoards
20 00 6•00 10.00 Wait On Daylight

12.00
MUD 3ECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED RIT RECORD

DEFTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TlME Dapp SI2E

wEleur pac-UL MFC

Y]S Pac-R TYPE
Poly+ -lET

PV/TP Fed-Zan SERIALNO.

MET C-325 DEVfHOUT

CA Myacide DEPN IN

GEIS Duragel TOTALFEET

AUC Asphasol HRS

pH Max Gei T/B/G

CAME C325 WT. ON BIT

CL DAILYCOST 10.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST ROP(fph)
%80005 CUMUMT1VECOST $0.00 AN VEL

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP D iTA DEVIATION RTMRD
NŒ DESCRIPFION LENGM - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Aamuth

MAKE Nat ÑBt

NODEL SPSO 8PSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
sPM Û
GPM 0.00
SURF PRESSURE 0.0
ECD

SLOWPUMP- SPN O 0
SLOWPUMP•PRES Û Û

AIR DrMing Operations data DAlLYWELI.cost $21,959
scm 0 PREVIOUSUM COST $24,523

U: DALG.XLS SHA 1048.88 IEECilON RATE Û ŒMURTIVE WELLCOST



Marion Energy inc. RECElVED

Šn ,"i Ñ9 SEPO4 2007

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DN.OFOIL,GAS&MINING
1EASESME &WEU.NO. HRD DAH

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak August 3, 2007
MGNME ANDNUMBER OXW STAH DAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 1
RNROEPfM Ant.As ga as FOOTAGEORRED UST CASDIG SEE, WEGHT,GRADE SET@ Rest No.

40' j 0 0 0 40' Conductor 40' 1
Acnyny Ar REPorr HME ItEPORTEDBY

Breaking Down Rig C.E. Crow/ R.M.Crow
REMARES KBTOGL

15
TIME1.03

mon To Houns Activity Detail
18•00 20:00 2.00 RiggingDown
20:00 6:00 10.00 Waiting On Daylight

12.00
MUD fIECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED BIT RECORD

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

Dapp SJZE
pac-UL MFG
Pac-R TYPE

PVM Fed-Zan SERTALNO.

MBT C-325 DEPTHO

CA MyacMe DEPTHIN
Duragel TUTALFEET

AIX Asphasol HRS

Max Get T/B/G

C325 WT. ON BI

CL DA1LYCilST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSOST ROP(fph)

%souns cUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL

DRIt.LING ASSE4BLY PUMP D ATA DEVI TION RECORD
NtA DEscRIPTION iÆNGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION[ Azmuth

MAKE Nat Nat
MODEL SPSD SPSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINERstzt 6.25 6.25
SPM 0
GPM 0.00
suRF PREssuRE 0.0
ECD

SLOWPUMP- SPM 0 0
SLOW PUMP- PREs O O

AIR DrMingOperadons data DAILYWELLCOST $24,523
scFM O PREVIOUSCUMCOST $0

u:wsoopoRIG xis BHA 1048.88 IN3ECTION RATE O CUMULATIVEWEL COST
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GPM 0.00
suRF PREssuRE 0.0
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AIR DrMingOperadons data DAILYWELLCOST $24,523
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Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 1
RNROEPfM Ant.As ga as FOOTAGEORRED UST CASDIG SEE, WEGHT,GRADE SET@ Rest No.

40' j 0 0 0 40' Conductor 40' 1
Acnyny Ar REPorr HME ItEPORTEDBY

Breaking Down Rig C.E. Crow/ R.M.Crow
REMARES KBTOGL

15
TIME1.03

mon To Houns Activity Detail
18•00 20:00 2.00 RiggingDown
20:00 6:00 10.00 Waiting On Daylight

12.00
MUD fIECORD MUD MATERIAIS USED BIT RECORD

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

Dapp SJZE
pac-UL MFG
Pac-R TYPE

PVM Fed-Zan SERTALNO.

MBT C-325 DEPTHO

CA MyacMe DEPTHIN

Duragel TUTALFEET

AIX Asphasol HRS

Max Get T/B/G

C325 WT. ON BI

CL DA1LYCilST $0.00 RPM

DAPP PREVIOUSOST ROP(fph)

%souns cUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ANVEL
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MODEL SPSD SPSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
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Marion Energy inc. 7'/4-5x of a 5-as

DAILYDRIt.LING REPORT
UXSEMW&WEU.NO. BRD DME

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak september10, 2007

IUGMME MD MMBER COMUY SMTE Days from spud

Unit Drilling Co . Rig 132 Emery Utah 28
TUTÆDEPm Rd.As cumR&.Hrs moTAGEORMED MSTCASmGSIZE,WBGK,GMDE SETO Reporta

7040' 225 7" 23# J-55 7023.55 39
ACRVITYAf REPORTTIME

REPORTEDBY

Rig down to Skid Rig. R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
ROGRIS

KBTOGL

Float set: 6988.48 RKB I Mt rker joint set at 5003.34 RKB 15
TIME I.OG

moli TO HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:00 2.00 Pull out of hole Lay down drill string (BHA)

8:00 9:30 1.50 Rig up casing crew
9:30 16:00 6.50 Run 161 jointsof 7" J-55 Casing with 8 round threads to 6997' tag fill with 20K set down wt Conn. Trg 3125

16:00 17:00 1.00 Circulate Fill casing and rig up Circulating swedge
17:00 18:00 1.00 Circulate and wash down casing from 6997' to 7023'

18:00 19:30 1.50 pickup landing jointand mandref I hook up cement head, wash down seat mandrel in well head.

19:30 21:00 1.50 Rig down casers and lay down truck/ Rig up cementers.
21:00 23:00 2.00 Cement casing as per below·

23:00 23:30 0.50 Rig down cement crew
23:30 3:00 3.50 Nipple down BOPE
3:00 6:00 3.00 RIG DOWN rig floor and sub.

Shoe set at 7023.55'RKB / Float set at 6988.48' RKB

Cement Specifications: Lead SIurry: 340sx Light Premium with 16% get, 3% saft, 3 #/sx GR3, 1/4 sx

flocele, 10#lsx Gilsonite g 11 ppgwith a yeildof 3.82
Tail slurry : 380 sx 50/50 paz with 10% salt Bwow, 1/4 #/sx flocele, 4% cff-115 14.2 ppgwith a
yeidof 1.62

Pumped 50 bbis ahead with no retums, no retums during jobBumped plugwith 450 psi over circulating
pressure of 700 psi. at 4.5 bpm Plug down at : 22:35

Total Clours 24.00 FUEL ANDWATER USF / BOILER HOURS STRINGWT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUELUSED 344/0 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP

Hrs. Mob.jDemolt 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 640 in 0 Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORi¢ 24.00 Total H2O ur ad on well & road 35840 Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS 1SED BIT tECOf D

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/1.BS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Poly Plus SIZE

WEIGHT Fed Seal MFG

VIS AL.Storate TYPE

WL DAPP TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT K<iCO SERIALNO.

CA Fed 744 DEPTHOUT

pH MaxGei HRS

CAKE Canon seed huis T/6/G

cL DAR.YCOST WT. ON BIT

DAPP PREVIOUSWET RPM UlV.Ul-UI , GA5ä MINN3

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOET $57,242.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP I ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD

NO. DESCMPTION LEN6tH - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 OEPIN Wib#$m-Ñmik

MAKE Nat Nat
MODEL 8P80 BP80
smong 8.50 8.50
a wasmo erwm C OC C

Marion Energy inc. 7'/4-5x of a 5-as

DAILYDRIt.LING REPORT
UXSEMW&WEU.NO. BRD DME

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak september10, 2007

IUGMME MD MMBER COMUY SMTE Days from spud

Unit Drilling Co . Rig 132 Emery Utah 28
TUTÆDEPm Rd.As cumR&.Hrs moTAGEORMED MSTCASmGSIZE,WBGK,GMDE SETO Reporta

7040' 225 7" 23# J-55 7023.55 39
ACRVITYAf REPORTTIME

REPORTEDBY

Rig down to Skid Rig. R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
ROGRIS

KBTOGL

Float set: 6988.48 RKB I Mt rker joint set at 5003.34 RKB 15
TIME I.OG

moli TO HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:00 2.00 Pull out of hole Lay down drill string (BHA)

8:00 9:30 1.50 Rig up casing crew
9:30 16:00 6.50 Run 161 jointsof 7" J-55 Casing with 8 round threads to 6997' tag fill with 20K set down wt Conn. Trg 3125

16:00 17:00 1.00 Circulate Fill casing and rig up Circulating swedge
17:00 18:00 1.00 Circulate and wash down casing from 6997' to 7023'

18:00 19:30 1.50 pickup landing jointand mandref I hook up cement head, wash down seat mandrel in well head.

19:30 21:00 1.50 Rig down casers and lay down truck/ Rig up cementers.
21:00 23:00 2.00 Cement casing as per below·

23:00 23:30 0.50 Rig down cement crew
23:30 3:00 3.50 Nipple down BOPE
3:00 6:00 3.00 RIG DOWN rig floor and sub.

Shoe set at 7023.55'RKB / Float set at 6988.48' RKB

Cement Specifications: Lead SIurry: 340sx Light Premium with 16% get, 3% saft, 3 #/sx GR3, 1/4 sx

flocele, 10#lsx Gilsonite g 11 ppgwith a yeildof 3.82
Tail slurry : 380 sx 50/50 paz with 10% salt Bwow, 1/4 #/sx flocele, 4% cff-115 14.2 ppgwith a
yeidof 1.62

Pumped 50 bbis ahead with no retums, no retums during jobBumped plugwith 450 psi over circulating
pressure of 700 psi. at 4.5 bpm Plug down at : 22:35

Total Clours 24.00 FUEL ANDWATER USF / BOILER HOURS STRINGWT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUELUSED 344/0 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP

Hrs. Mob.jDemolt 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 640 in 0 Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORi¢ 24.00 Total H2O ur ad on well & road 35840 Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS 1SED BIT tECOf D

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/1.BS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Poly Plus SIZE

WEIGHT Fed Seal MFG

VIS AL.Storate TYPE

WL DAPP TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT K<iCO SERIALNO.

CA Fed 744 DEPTHOUT

pH MaxGei HRS

CAKE Canon seed huis T/6/G

cL DAR.YCOST WT. ON BIT

DAPP PREVIOUSWET RPM UlV.Ul-UI , GA5ä MINN3

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOET $57,242.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP I ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD

NO. DESCMPTION LEN6tH - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 OEPIN Wib#$m-Ñmik

MAKE Nat Nat
MODEL 8P80 BP80
smong 8.50 8.50
a wasmo erwm C OC C

Marion Energy inc. 7'/4-5x of a 5-as

DAILYDRIt.LING REPORT
UXSEMW&WEU.NO. BRD DME

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak september10, 2007

IUGMME MD MMBER COMUY SMTE Days from spud

Unit Drilling Co . Rig 132 Emery Utah 28
TUTÆDEPm Rd.As cumR&.Hrs moTAGEORMED MSTCASmGSIZE,WBGK,GMDE SETO Reporta

7040' 225 7" 23# J-55 7023.55 39
ACRVITYAf REPORTTIME

REPORTEDBY

Rig down to Skid Rig. R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
ROGRIS

KBTOGL

Float set: 6988.48 RKB I Mt rker joint set at 5003.34 RKB 15
TIME I.OG

moli TO HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:00 2.00 Pull out of hole Lay down drill string (BHA)

8:00 9:30 1.50 Rig up casing crew
9:30 16:00 6.50 Run 161 jointsof 7" J-55 Casing with 8 round threads to 6997' tag fill with 20K set down wt Conn. Trg 3125

16:00 17:00 1.00 Circulate Fill casing and rig up Circulating swedge
17:00 18:00 1.00 Circulate and wash down casing from 6997' to 7023'

18:00 19:30 1.50 pickup landing jointand mandref I hook up cement head, wash down seat mandrel in well head.

19:30 21:00 1.50 Rig down casers and lay down truck/ Rig up cementers.
21:00 23:00 2.00 Cement casing as per below·

23:00 23:30 0.50 Rig down cement crew
23:30 3:00 3.50 Nipple down BOPE
3:00 6:00 3.00 RIG DOWN rig floor and sub.

Shoe set at 7023.55'RKB / Float set at 6988.48' RKB

Cement Specifications: Lead SIurry: 340sx Light Premium with 16% get, 3% saft, 3 #/sx GR3, 1/4 sx

flocele, 10#lsx Gilsonite g 11 ppgwith a yeildof 3.82
Tail slurry : 380 sx 50/50 paz with 10% salt Bwow, 1/4 #/sx flocele, 4% cff-115 14.2 ppgwith a
yeidof 1.62

Pumped 50 bbis ahead with no retums, no retums during jobBumped plugwith 450 psi over circulating
pressure of 700 psi. at 4.5 bpm Plug down at : 22:35

Total Clours 24.00 FUEL ANDWATER USF / BOILER HOURS STRINGWT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUELUSED 344/0 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP

Hrs. Mob.jDemolt 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 640 in 0 Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORi¢ 24.00 Total H2O ur ad on well & road 35840 Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS 1SED BIT tECOf D

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/1.BS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Poly Plus SIZE

WEIGHT Fed Seal MFG

VIS AL.Storate TYPE

WL DAPP TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT K<iCO SERIALNO.

CA Fed 744 DEPTHOUT

pH MaxGei HRS

CAKE Canon seed huis T/6/G

cL DAR.YCOST WT. ON BIT

DAPP PREVIOUSWET RPM UlV.Ul-UI , GA5ä MINN3

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOET $57,242.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP I ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD

NO. DESCMPTION LEN6tH - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 OEPIN Wib#$m-Ñmik

MAKE Nat Nat
MODEL 8P80 BP80
smong 8.50 8.50
a wasmo erwm C OC C



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
LMSE NME & WEL NO. RRD DME

Ridge Runner 8-19 Gear creak september9, 2007
RIGNME MD NUMBER CMHY STm Days from spud

Unit Drilling Co . Rig 132 Emery Utah 27
sora DWW Rd. Ws cumRd. His OTAGEDRIRED MET CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Repst &

7040' 225 9 5/8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 38
ACT1VOYATREÞORTTIME REPORTEDUf

I.ay down drillstring(BHA) ¡R.L.Tatman| Shiloh Williams
amARKS

KBTDGL.

TD well 7040' at 06:50 MST.<n 9/7/07 / Loggers TD @7000' 15
TIMELOG

FROBS 10 HOuns ACTIVITYDETAIL
6:00 9:00 3,00 Trip in hole to 2800', Kelly up
9:00 9:30 0.50 Blow hole dry
9:30 10:00 0.50 Trip in hole to casing shoe.
10:00 11:30 1.50 Blow hole dry with 1800 cfm air.
11:30 12:00 0.50 Kelly up pumpair pillto 700 Psi
12:00 13:30 1.50 Trip in hole to 6995'
13:30 18:00 4.50 air pillhole and tyrto establish retuns with 1800 cfm and 190 gpmthen 2400 cfm and 190 gpm
18:00 19:00 1.00 Ream from 6995' to 7040' establish retums while reaming.

19:00 20:30 1.50 Circulate bottoms up and rig up lay down machine.
20:30 21:00 0.50 Work tighthole
21 6:00 9.00 Pull out of hole Lay down drill string.

Total f loum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 781/701 Gattons Boiler Hours NA UP 190,000

Hrs. Mob./Demok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 1350 In 0 O DOWN 100,000

TOTALDAYWORE 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 35200 Barrels ROTATE 128,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECOTD

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME Eff NO. 6

TIME Poly Plus SIZE 8 3/4

WEIGHT Fed Sul MFG Security

VIS AL.Sterate TYPE XS25S

WL DAPP TFA Open

Pv/yP Fed-zan lET Open

MBT K<00 SERIALNo. 10731349

CA Fed 744 DEFTHOUT 7022'

GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 6728

ALK C-325 TOTALŒET 294'

pH MaxGel Has 8.00

CAKE Cotton seed hulis T/8/G

CL DAILYCOST WT. ON BIT 32-35K

DAPP PREVIOUSCO5T RPM 50/128

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $57,242.00 ROP(fph) 36.8
DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP &ATA I*EVIATIONRg )RD

500. DESCMPTION LENGTH - FF PUBSPNO. 1 2 •L*ENIT4¾

ptAKE Nat Nat
BSODEL 8P80 8P80 SEP13 2007
smoxE 8.50 8.50
.......-.. « or « oc Jiv. UP UIL,UAS&

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
LMSE NME & WEL NO. RRD DME

Ridge Runner 8-19 Gear creak september9, 2007
RIGNME MD NUMBER CMHY STm Days from spud

Unit Drilling Co . Rig 132 Emery Utah 27
sora DWW Rd. Ws cumRd. His OTAGEDRIRED MET CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Repst &

7040' 225 9 5/8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 38
ACT1VOYATREÞORTTIME REPORTEDUf

I.ay down drillstring(BHA) ¡R.L.Tatman| Shiloh Williams
amARKS

KBTDGL.

TD well 7040' at 06:50 MST.<n 9/7/07 / Loggers TD @7000' 15
TIMELOG

FROBS 10 HOuns ACTIVITYDETAIL
6:00 9:00 3,00 Trip in hole to 2800', Kelly up
9:00 9:30 0.50 Blow hole dry
9:30 10:00 0.50 Trip in hole to casing shoe.
10:00 11:30 1.50 Blow hole dry with 1800 cfm air.
11:30 12:00 0.50 Kelly up pumpair pillto 700 Psi
12:00 13:30 1.50 Trip in hole to 6995'
13:30 18:00 4.50 air pillhole and tyrto establish retuns with 1800 cfm and 190 gpmthen 2400 cfm and 190 gpm
18:00 19:00 1.00 Ream from 6995' to 7040' establish retums while reaming.

19:00 20:30 1.50 Circulate bottoms up and rig up lay down machine.
20:30 21:00 0.50 Work tighthole
21 6:00 9.00 Pull out of hole Lay down drill string.

Total f loum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 781/701 Gattons Boiler Hours NA UP 190,000

Hrs. Mob./Demok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 1350 In 0 O DOWN 100,000

TOTALDAYWORE 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 35200 Barrels ROTATE 128,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECOTD

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME Eff NO. 6

TIME Poly Plus SIZE 8 3/4

WEIGHT Fed Sul MFG Security

VIS AL.Sterate TYPE XS25S

WL DAPP TFA Open

Pv/yP Fed-zan lET Open

MBT K<00 SERIALNo. 10731349

CA Fed 744 DEFTHOUT 7022'

GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 6728

ALK C-325 TOTALŒET 294'

pH MaxGel Has 8.00

CAKE Cotton seed hulis T/8/G

CL DAILYCOST WT. ON BIT 32-35K

DAPP PREVIOUSCO5T RPM 50/128

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $57,242.00 ROP(fph) 36.8
DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP &ATA I*EVIATIONRg )RD

500. DESCMPTION LENGTH - FF PUBSPNO. 1 2 •L*ENIT4¾

ptAKE Nat Nat
BSODEL 8P80 8P80 SEP13 2007
smoxE 8.50 8.50
.......-.. « or « oc Jiv. UP UIL,UAS&

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
LMSE NME & WEL NO. RRD DME

Ridge Runner 8-19 Gear creak september9, 2007
RIGNME MD NUMBER CMHY STm Days from spud

Unit Drilling Co . Rig 132 Emery Utah 27
sora DWW Rd. Ws cumRd. His OTAGEDRIRED MET CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Repst &

7040' 225 9 5/8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 38
ACT1VOYATREÞORTTIME REPORTEDUf

I.ay down drillstring(BHA) ¡R.L.Tatman| Shiloh Williams
amARKS

KBTDGL.

TD well 7040' at 06:50 MST.<n 9/7/07 / Loggers TD @7000' 15
TIMELOG

FROBS 10 HOuns ACTIVITYDETAIL
6:00 9:00 3,00 Trip in hole to 2800', Kelly up
9:00 9:30 0.50 Blow hole dry
9:30 10:00 0.50 Trip in hole to casing shoe.
10:00 11:30 1.50 Blow hole dry with 1800 cfm air.
11:30 12:00 0.50 Kelly up pumpair pillto 700 Psi
12:00 13:30 1.50 Trip in hole to 6995'
13:30 18:00 4.50 air pillhole and tyrto establish retuns with 1800 cfm and 190 gpmthen 2400 cfm and 190 gpm
18:00 19:00 1.00 Ream from 6995' to 7040' establish retums while reaming.

19:00 20:30 1.50 Circulate bottoms up and rig up lay down machine.
20:30 21:00 0.50 Work tighthole
21 6:00 9.00 Pull out of hole Lay down drill string.

Total f loum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 781/701 Gattons Boiler Hours NA UP 190,000

Hrs. Mob./Demok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 1350 In 0 O DOWN 100,000

TOTALDAYWORE 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 35200 Barrels ROTATE 128,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECOTD

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME Eff NO. 6

TIME Poly Plus SIZE 8 3/4

WEIGHT Fed Sul MFG Security

VIS AL.Sterate TYPE XS25S

WL DAPP TFA Open

Pv/yP Fed-zan lET Open

MBT K<00 SERIALNo. 10731349

CA Fed 744 DEFTHOUT 7022'

GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 6728

ALK C-325 TOTALŒET 294'

pH MaxGel Has 8.00

CAKE Cotton seed hulis T/8/G

CL DAILYCOST WT. ON BIT 32-35K

DAPP PREVIOUSCO5T RPM 50/128

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $57,242.00 ROP(fph) 36.8
DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP &ATA I*EVIATIONRg )RD

500. DESCMPTION LENGTH - FF PUBSPNO. 1 2 •L*ENIT4¾

ptAKE Nat Nat
BSODEL 8P80 8P80 SEP13 2007
smoxE 8.50 8.50
.......-.. « or « oc Jiv. UP UIL,UAS&



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
IRSE ME & WEU.NO. RED DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Gear Creak September 8, 2007
RIGME ANDMUMBER COUN1Y STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling Co . Rig 132 Emery Utah 26
TOTM.DEmi Rd, as cum Ret. Hrs FOOTAGEDIURED LA5f CASMGSlZE, WBGHT, GRADE SETO Repart No.

7040' | 1 225 18' \9 5/8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 37
£71VHY ATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Trip in hole to laydown drill string R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
REMMS TO GL.

TDwell 7040' at 06:50 MST.t n 9/7/07 I Loggers TD @7000' 15
TIME LOG

MON vo nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 Drilling 8 3/4" hole from 7022' to 7040' with mud motor and
7:00 8:00 1.00 Circulate bottoms up
8:00 12:00 4.00 Whiper tripout to 3800 then back to 7010' (taggedfill)
12:00 18:00 6.00 Attempted to break circulation at 7000', worked pipeup and down pumped180 ppmand 1800 cfm air.
18:00 0:30 6.50 Pull out of hole kelleyed up pumpdisp again to stop flow, pullout of hole lay down mud motor.
0:30 3:00 2.50 Rig up loggers and log ist run: Compensated density, duel induction,GL and Gamma.
3110 5:00 2.00 Log 2nd run: Caliper, Gamma, Compensated neutron. Loggers TD= 7000'
5:00 5:30 0.50 Rig down Phonix Surveys loging crew
5:30 6:00 0.50 Pick up bit sub and trip in hole

Total Ileurs 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUELUSED 781/620 Gattons Boiler Hours NA UP 190,000

Hss. Mob.jDemott 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 1970 In 0 O DOWN 100,000
TOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 33850 Barrels ROTATE 128,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSi lSED BIT RECOl D
DEFTH 7040 No. oF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BTTNO. 6
nME 20:00 Poly Plus SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 8.4 Fed seal MFG Security
VIs 28 AL.Storate TYPE XS25S
WL 70 DAPP TFA Open
Pv/YP Fed-zan JET Open
MST K-600 SERIA1.No. 10731349
CA 15 Fed 744 DEFTHOUT 7022'
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 6728
ALx 0.0/0.15 C-325 TOTALFEET 294'
pH 7 MaxGel HRS 8.00
"AKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G

et 400 DAILYCOST $2,250.00 WT. ON BIT 32-35K

DAPP 7.0 PREVIOUSCOST $55,000.00 RPM 50/128
%sonos 0.00 CUMULATIVECOST $57,242.00 ROP(fph) 36.8

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP I ATA )€VIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCIUPHON LENGm - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DERN R

1 BIT 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat
1 MOTOR 23.37 MODEL 8PSO 8P8e

- FP1 3 2007
6 6" DC 184.03 STRONE 8.50 8.50
O IJWrtD 974 14 a wmma erwm A SC A 94 DN.0 OIL,GAS&

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
IRSE ME & WEU.NO. RED DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Gear Creak September 8, 2007
RIGME ANDMUMBER COUN1Y STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling Co . Rig 132 Emery Utah 26
TOTM.DEmi Rd, as cum Ret. Hrs FOOTAGEDIURED LA5f CASMGSlZE, WBGHT, GRADE SETO Repart No.

7040' | 1 225 18' \9 5/8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 37
£71VHY ATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Trip in hole to laydown drill string R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
REMMS TO GL.

TDwell 7040' at 06:50 MST.t n 9/7/07 I Loggers TD @7000' 15
TIME LOG

MON vo nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 Drilling 8 3/4" hole from 7022' to 7040' with mud motor and
7:00 8:00 1.00 Circulate bottoms up
8:00 12:00 4.00 Whiper tripout to 3800 then back to 7010' (taggedfill)
12:00 18:00 6.00 Attempted to break circulation at 7000', worked pipeup and down pumped180 ppmand 1800 cfm air.
18:00 0:30 6.50 Pull out of hole kelleyed up pumpdisp again to stop flow, pullout of hole lay down mud motor.
0:30 3:00 2.50 Rig up loggers and log ist run: Compensated density, duel induction,GL and Gamma.
3110 5:00 2.00 Log 2nd run: Caliper, Gamma, Compensated neutron. Loggers TD= 7000'
5:00 5:30 0.50 Rig down Phonix Surveys loging crew
5:30 6:00 0.50 Pick up bit sub and trip in hole

Total Ileurs 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUELUSED 781/620 Gattons Boiler Hours NA UP 190,000

Hss. Mob.jDemott 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 1970 In 0 O DOWN 100,000
TOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 33850 Barrels ROTATE 128,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSi lSED BIT RECOl D
DEFTH 7040 No. oF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BTTNO. 6
nME 20:00 Poly Plus SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 8.4 Fed seal MFG Security

VIs 28 AL.Storate TYPE XS25S
WL 70 DAPP TFA Open
Pv/YP Fed-zan JET Open

MST K-600 SERIA1.No. 10731349
CA 15 Fed 744 DEFTHOUT 7022'
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 6728
ALx 0.0/0.15 C-325 TOTALFEET 294'
pH 7 MaxGel HRS 8.00
"AKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G

et 400 DAILYCOST $2,250.00 WT. ON BIT 32-35K

DAPP 7.0 PREVIOUSCOST $55,000.00 RPM 50/128
%sonos 0.00 CUMULATIVECOST $57,242.00 ROP(fph) 36.8

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP I ATA )€VIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCIUPHON LENGm - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DERN R

1 BIT 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat
1 MOTOR 23.37 MODEL 8PSO 8P8e

- FP1 3 2007
6 6" DC 184.03 STRONE 8.50 8.50
O IJWrtD 974 14 a wmma erwm A SC A 94 DN.0 OIL,GAS&

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
IRSE ME & WEU.NO. RED DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Gear Creak September 8, 2007
RIGME ANDMUMBER COUN1Y STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling Co . Rig 132 Emery Utah 26
TOTM.DEmi Rd, as cum Ret. Hrs FOOTAGEDIURED LA5f CASMGSlZE, WBGHT, GRADE SETO Repart No.

7040' | 1 225 18' \9 5/8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 37
£71VHY ATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Trip in hole to laydown drill string R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
REMMS TO GL.

TDwell 7040' at 06:50 MST.t n 9/7/07 I Loggers TD @7000' 15
TIME LOG

MON vo nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 Drilling 8 3/4" hole from 7022' to 7040' with mud motor and
7:00 8:00 1.00 Circulate bottoms up
8:00 12:00 4.00 Whiper tripout to 3800 then back to 7010' (taggedfill)
12:00 18:00 6.00 Attempted to break circulation at 7000', worked pipeup and down pumped180 ppmand 1800 cfm air.
18:00 0:30 6.50 Pull out of hole kelleyed up pumpdisp again to stop flow, pullout of hole lay down mud motor.
0:30 3:00 2.50 Rig up loggers and log ist run: Compensated density, duel induction,GL and Gamma.
3110 5:00 2.00 Log 2nd run: Caliper, Gamma, Compensated neutron. Loggers TD= 7000'
5:00 5:30 0.50 Rig down Phonix Surveys loging crew
5:30 6:00 0.50 Pick up bit sub and trip in hole

Total Ileurs 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUELUSED 781/620 Gattons Boiler Hours NA UP 190,000

Hss. Mob.jDemott 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 1970 In 0 O DOWN 100,000
TOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 33850 Barrels ROTATE 128,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSi lSED BIT RECOl D
DEFTH 7040 No. oF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BTTNO. 6
nME 20:00 Poly Plus SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 8.4 Fed seal MFG Security

VIs 28 AL.Storate TYPE XS25S
WL 70 DAPP TFA Open
Pv/YP Fed-zan JET Open

MST K-600 SERIA1.No. 10731349
CA 15 Fed 744 DEFTHOUT 7022'
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 6728
ALx 0.0/0.15 C-325 TOTALFEET 294'
pH 7 MaxGel HRS 8.00
"AKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G

et 400 DAILYCOST $2,250.00 WT. ON BIT 32-35K

DAPP 7.0 PREVIOUSCOST $55,000.00 RPM 50/128
%sonos 0.00 CUMULATIVECOST $57,242.00 ROP(fph) 36.8

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP I ATA )€VIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCIUPHON LENGm - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DERN R

1 BIT 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat
1 MOTOR 23.37 MODEL 8PSO 8P8e

- FP1 3 2007
6 6" DC 184.03 STRONE 8.50 8.50
O IJWrtD 974 14 a wmma erwm A SC A 94 DN.0 OIL,GAS&



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
LOSE MME &WEU.NO. RED DŒ

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak September 7, 2007
RIGMMEMIDNUMBER COUKIY STATE CAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 36
fØTALDONH Ret. Hrs cumR t.Hrs FOOTAGEDIURED LAsi CASINGSIZE,WBGHT, GRADE SETO Report No.

7022' 4 224 170' 9 5/8N 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 36
ACOVITYATHEFORTTIME REPORTEDBY

circulatingbottoms up to short trip R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
RÐMRMS KBTOGL.

TD well 7040' at 06:50 MST. 15
TIME LOG

Fann To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 11:30 5.50 Trip out of hole
11:30 15:00 3.50 Break off bit, lay down directional tools, change out mud motor, Function test BOPE., scribe motor streight
15¾ 19:00 4.00 Trip in hole to 4000'
19:00 20:00 1.00 Break circulation at 4000'
20:00 22:00 2.00 Trip in hole to 5800,Kellyup, pumpair pillto 700 psi then pumpdrill , trip in hole.
22:00 2:00 4.00 Kelly up break circulation, ream to bottom 8 ps,Tagged bottom.
2·00 6:00 4.00 Dritiing 8 3/4" hole from 6852' to 7022' with mud motor and

Total Cours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USF I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 506/575 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 190,000

Hss. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 540 In 0 Out DOWN 100,000
TOTALDAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O w ad on well & road 31880 Barrels ROTATE 128,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECOFD

DEPTH 6852' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BYTNO. 6
TIME 17:00 1 Poly Plus SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 8.4 Fod Seal MFG Security
vis 28 0 AL.Starate TYPE XS25S
WL 20 DAPP TFA Open
PV/YP 2 Fed-Zan JET Open
MST K-600 SERIALNo. 10731349
CA 15 Fed 744 DEFU OUT 7022'
GEI.S Duragel DEPTHIN 6728
ALK 0.0/0.15 C-325 TOTAL??ET 294'
pH 7 0 MaxGel HRS 8.ÛÛ
00:E Cotton seed hulls T/B/G

"L 400 DAILYCOST $1,472.00 WT. ON BIT 32-35K

DAPP 7.0 PREVIOUSCOST $51,210.00 RPM 50/128
%soues 0.00 CUMULATIVECOST $52,682.00 ROP(fph) 36.8

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP &ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
NO; DESCMPTION EBi6TH - FT PUB4PNO. 1 2 OEPN

1 BIT 1.00 BGAME Nat Nat 6705' 2.1 5.8
1 MOTOR 23.37 pt0DEL SP80 8P80 EP13 2007
6 6" DC 184.03 smOME 8.50 8.50
a uwno na 2e ........- a as a >=

DNOFOLGAS&

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
LOSE MME &WEU.NO. RED DŒ

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak September 7, 2007
RIGMMEMIDNUMBER COUKIY STATE CAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 36
fØTALDONH Ret. Hrs cumR t.Hrs FOOTAGEDIURED LAsi CASINGSIZE,WBGHT, GRADE SETO Report No.

7022' 4 224 170' 9 5/8N 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 36
ACOVITYATHEFORTTIME REPORTEDBY

circulatingbottoms up to short trip R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
RÐMRMS KBTOGL.

TD well 7040' at 06:50 MST. 15
TIME LOG

Fann To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 11:30 5.50 Trip out of hole
11:30 15:00 3.50 Break off bit, lay down directional tools, change out mud motor, Function test BOPE., scribe motor streight

15¾ 19:00 4.00 Trip in hole to 4000'
19:00 20:00 1.00 Break circulation at 4000'
20:00 22:00 2.00 Trip in hole to 5800,Kellyup, pumpair pillto 700 psi then pumpdrill , trip in hole.
22:00 2:00 4.00 Kelly up break circulation, ream to bottom 8 ps,Tagged bottom.
2·00 6:00 4.00 Dritiing 8 3/4" hole from 6852' to 7022' with mud motor and

Total Cours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USF I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 506/575 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 190,000

Hss. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 540 In 0 Out DOWN 100,000
TOTALDAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O w ad on well & road 31880 Barrels ROTATE 128,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECOFD

DEPTH 6852' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BYTNO. 6
TIME 17:00 1 Poly Plus SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 8.4 Fod Seal MFG Security
vis 28 0 AL.Starate TYPE XS25S
WL 20 DAPP TFA Open
PV/YP 2 Fed-Zan JET Open
MST K-600 SERIALNo. 10731349
CA 15 Fed 744 DEFU OUT 7022'

GEI.S Duragel DEPTHIN 6728
ALK 0.0/0.15 C-325 TOTAL??ET 294'
pH 7 0 MaxGel HRS 8.ÛÛ
00:E Cotton seed hulls T/B/G

"L 400 DAILYCOST $1,472.00 WT. ON BIT 32-35K

DAPP 7.0 PREVIOUSCOST $51,210.00 RPM 50/128
%soues 0.00 CUMULATIVECOST $52,682.00 ROP(fph) 36.8

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP &ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
NO; DESCMPTION EBi6TH - FT PUB4PNO. 1 2 OEPN

1 BIT 1.00 BGAME Nat Nat 6705' 2.1 5.8
1 MOTOR 23.37 pt0DEL SP80 8P80 EP13 2007
6 6" DC 184.03 smOME 8.50 8.50
a uwno na 2e ........- a as a >=

DNOFOLGAS&

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
LOSE MME &WEU.NO. RED DŒ

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak September 7, 2007
RIGMMEMIDNUMBER COUKIY STATE CAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 36
fØTALDONH Ret. Hrs cumR t.Hrs FOOTAGEDIURED LAsi CASINGSIZE,WBGHT, GRADE SETO Report No.

7022' 4 224 170' 9 5/8N 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 36
ACOVITYATHEFORTTIME REPORTEDBY

circulatingbottoms up to short trip R.L.Tatman | Shiloh Williams
RÐMRMS KBTOGL.

TD well 7040' at 06:50 MST. 15
TIME LOG

Fann To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 11:30 5.50 Trip out of hole
11:30 15:00 3.50 Break off bit, lay down directional tools, change out mud motor, Function test BOPE., scribe motor streight

15¾ 19:00 4.00 Trip in hole to 4000'
19:00 20:00 1.00 Break circulation at 4000'
20:00 22:00 2.00 Trip in hole to 5800,Kellyup, pumpair pillto 700 psi then pumpdrill , trip in hole.
22:00 2:00 4.00 Kelly up break circulation, ream to bottom 8 ps,Tagged bottom.
2·00 6:00 4.00 Dritiing 8 3/4" hole from 6852' to 7022' with mud motor and

Total Cours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USF I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 506/575 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 190,000

Hss. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 540 In 0 Out DOWN 100,000
TOTALDAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O w ad on well & road 31880 Barrels ROTATE 128,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECOFD

DEPTH 6852' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BYTNO. 6
TIME 17:00 1 Poly Plus SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 8.4 Fod Seal MFG Security
vis 28 0 AL.Starate TYPE XS25S
WL 20 DAPP TFA Open
PV/YP 2 Fed-Zan JET Open
MST K-600 SERIALNo. 10731349
CA 15 Fed 744 DEFU OUT 7022'

GEI.S Duragel DEPTHIN 6728
ALK 0.0/0.15 C-325 TOTAL??ET 294'
pH 7 0 MaxGel HRS 8.ÛÛ
00:E Cotton seed hulls T/B/G

"L 400 DAILYCOST $1,472.00 WT. ON BIT 32-35K

DAPP 7.0 PREVIOUSCOST $51,210.00 RPM 50/128
%soues 0.00 CUMULATIVECOST $52,682.00 ROP(fph) 36.8

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP &ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
NO; DESCMPTION EBi6TH - FT PUB4PNO. 1 2 OEPN

1 BIT 1.00 BGAME Nat Nat 6705' 2.1 5.8
1 MOTOR 23.37 pt0DEL SP80 8P80 EP13 2007
6 6" DC 184.03 smOME 8.50 8.50
a uwno na 2e ........- a as a >=

DNOFOLGAS&



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
ŒASEMM &WER NO. HRD DE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak September 6, 2007
RIGMNE MID MtWBER COUNTY STATE DAYNO.

UnitDrilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 35
WTÆ OSH Ret. His cumRat. His FOGTME DRIRED UGT CASINGSIZE,WBGHT, GMDE SET& Reput No.

6728' 5.5 220 115' 9 5/8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 35
mrvnYAFEBWTTIME REPORTEDBY

TOOH For Plugged Bit ¡C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
REMARS KBTO GL.

Bit Plugged Up After Rolling *ump For Survey 15
TIME LC3

mose to nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:30 1.50 TIH
7:30 8:00 0.50 Survey
8:00 14:30 6.50 Work Tight Hole And Wstablish Returns/ Pumped 1500bbis Wl1800CFM Before Establishing Returns
14·30 20:00 5.50 Wash & Ream/ 6600'4728'
20:00 0:00 4.00 DrillActual/ 6728'4852'
0 00 0:30 0.50 Survey
0:30 4:30 4.00 Pressure Spike After Survey 1400psil LD 5-Jts Dp While Attempting To Unplug Bit
4:30 6:00 1.50 TIH To Unplug Bit

Total Cours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USI I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUELUSED 650/950 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 190

Hes. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 600 in 0 O DOWN 120
TOTALDAVWORP 24.00 Total H2O ur ad on well & road 31340 Barrels ROTATE 132

MUD (ECORD MUD MATERIALS ISED BIT RECOF D
DEPIN 6728 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 6
TIME 11:00 1 Poly plus SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 8.4 Fed Seal MFG Security
vis 28 1 AL Starate TYPE XS25S
WL 80 DAPP TFA Open
PV/YP 2 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT KR SERIALNo. 10731349
CA 10 Fed 744 DEPTHouT 6852
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 6728
ALK 0.0/0.15 C-325 TOTALFEET 124
pH 7 4 MaxGel HRs 4.00
'AKE Colinn seed hulls T/B/G

"L 400 DAILYCOST $2,987.00 WT. ON BIT 32-35K

DAFP 4.0% PREVIOUSCOST RPM 50/128
%souns 0.00 CUMULATIVECOST $51,210.00 ROP(fph) 31.0

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP LATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
NO. DESCMPHON LENGHi - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPHI MgQ AM

1 BIT 1.00 MANE Nat Nat 6705' 42.1(295.8
1 MØTOR 23.37 MoDEL 8PSO 8P80 RP l AZUU/
1 PONYNMDC 10.00 STROKE 8.50

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
ŒASEMM &WER NO. HRD DE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak September 6, 2007
RIGMNE MID MtWBER COUNTY STATE DAYNO.

UnitDrilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 35
WTÆ OSH Ret. His cumRat. His FOGTME DRIRED UGT CASINGSIZE,WBGHT, GMDE SET& Reput No.

6728' 5.5 220 115' 9 5/8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 35
mrvnYAFEBWTTIME REPORTEDBY

TOOH For Plugged Bit ¡C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
REMARS KBTO GL.

Bit Plugged Up After Rolling *ump For Survey 15
TIME LC3

mose to nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:30 1.50 TIH
7:30 8:00 0.50 Survey
8:00 14:30 6.50 Work Tight Hole And Wstablish Returns/ Pumped 1500bbis Wl1800CFM Before Establishing Returns
14·30 20:00 5.50 Wash & Ream/ 6600'4728'
20:00 0:00 4.00 DrillActual/ 6728'4852'
0 00 0:30 0.50 Survey
0:30 4:30 4.00 Pressure Spike After Survey 1400psil LD 5-Jts Dp While Attempting To Unplug Bit
4:30 6:00 1.50 TIH To Unplug Bit

Total Cours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USI I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUELUSED 650/950 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 190

Hes. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 600 in 0 O DOWN 120
TOTALDAVWORP 24.00 Total H2O ur ad on well & road 31340 Barrels ROTATE 132

MUD (ECORD MUD MATERIALS ISED BIT RECOF D
DEPIN 6728 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 6
TIME 11:00 1 Poly plus SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 8.4 Fed Seal MFG Security
vis 28 1 AL Starate TYPE XS25S
WL 80 DAPP TFA Open
PV/YP 2 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT KR SERIALNo. 10731349
CA 10 Fed 744 DEPTHouT 6852
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 6728
ALK 0.0/0.15 C-325 TOTALFEET 124
pH 7 4 MaxGel HRs 4.00
'AKE Colinn seed hulls T/B/G

"L 400 DAILYCOST $2,987.00 WT. ON BIT 32-35K

DAFP 4.0% PREVIOUSCOST RPM 50/128
%souns 0.00 CUMULATIVECOST $51,210.00 ROP(fph) 31.0

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP LATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
NO. DESCMPHON LENGHi - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPHI MgQ AM

1 BIT 1.00 MANE Nat Nat 6705' 42.1(295.8
1 MØTOR 23.37 MoDEL 8PSO 8P80 RP l AZUU/
1 PONYNMDC 10.00 STROKE 8.50

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
ŒASEMM &WER NO. HRD DE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak September 6, 2007
RIGMNE MID MtWBER COUNTY STATE DAYNO.

UnitDrilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 35
WTÆ OSH Ret. His cumRat. His FOGTME DRIRED UGT CASINGSIZE,WBGHT, GMDE SET& Reput No.

6728' 5.5 220 115' 9 5/8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 35
mrvnYAFEBWTTIME REPORTEDBY

TOOH For Plugged Bit ¡C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
REMARS KBTO GL.

Bit Plugged Up After Rolling *ump For Survey 15
TIME LC3

mose to nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:30 1.50 TIH
7:30 8:00 0.50 Survey
8:00 14:30 6.50 Work Tight Hole And Wstablish Returns/ Pumped 1500bbis Wl1800CFM Before Establishing Returns
14·30 20:00 5.50 Wash & Ream/ 6600'4728'
20:00 0:00 4.00 DrillActual/ 6728'4852'
0 00 0:30 0.50 Survey
0:30 4:30 4.00 Pressure Spike After Survey 1400psil LD 5-Jts Dp While Attempting To Unplug Bit
4:30 6:00 1.50 TIH To Unplug Bit

Total Cours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USI I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUELUSED 650/950 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 190

Hes. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 600 in 0 O DOWN 120
TOTALDAVWORP 24.00 Total H2O ur ad on well & road 31340 Barrels ROTATE 132

MUD (ECORD MUD MATERIALS ISED BIT RECOF D
DEPIN 6728 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 6
TIME 11:00 1 Poly plus SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 8.4 Fed Seal MFG Security
vis 28 1 AL Starate TYPE XS25S
WL 80 DAPP TFA Open
PV/YP 2 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT KR SERIALNo. 10731349
CA 10 Fed 744 DEPTHouT 6852
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 6728
ALK 0.0/0.15 C-325 TOTALFEET 124
pH 7 4 MaxGel HRs 4.00
'AKE Colinn seed hulls T/B/G

"L 400 DAILYCOST $2,987.00 WT. ON BIT 32-35K

DAFP 4.0% PREVIOUSCOST RPM 50/128
%souns 0.00 CUMULATIVECOST $51,210.00 ROP(fph) 31.0

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP LATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
NO. DESCMPHON LENGHi - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPHI MgQ AM

1 BIT 1.00 MANE Nat Nat 6705' 42.1(295.8
1 MØTOR 23.37 MoDEL 8PSO 8P80 RP l AZUU/
1 PONYNMDC 10.00 STROKE 8.50



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
ŒASEMME &WRL NO. RED DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Gear Creak September 5, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE DAY NO.

Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Emery Utah 34
(OTALDEPU Rot His aan Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEORIRED MST CASINGSIZE,WHGRF, GRADE SEr O Report No.

6728' 5.5 220 115' 9 5/8" 36# .3-55 3890.61 RBK 34
ACTIVI1YATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Orc Wellbore C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
REMARKS KBTOGL

Broke Circ Out Of intermedit te 10' Flare 10,336 Units Gas For 15-Min 15
TIME LO3

ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:30 1.50 Drill Actuall 6613'-6659'
7:30 8:00 0.50 Survey
8:00 12:00 4.00 Drill Actual/ 6659'41728'l Differiential Spiking Prepare To TOOH
12:00 14:00 2.00 Lost Returns Circ. Stms. Up/ Regained Circ. Circ. Stms Up
14:00 14:30 0.50 Circ Fluid Through String & Up To Shoe/ With Air Off
14:30 22:30 8.00 TOOH For Bit #5 & Inspect Mud Mtr.
22:30 23:00 0.50 Layed Down Mud Motor/Pick Up Mud Motor &Bit
23:00 23:30 0.50 Repair Compound Chain
23:30 0:00 0.50 Function Test BOP'S
0:00 1:00 1.00 Scribe Directional Tools
1:00 4:30 3.50 TIH W/ Bit #6 To 3960'
4:30 6:00 1.50 PU Kelly & Break Circ/ Circ Gas Out Of Well Bore 10,336 Units 10' High Flare For 15 Min

Total iars 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USI I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair 0.50 FUEL USED 650/950 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 178

Hrs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 600 in 0 O DOWN 113
TOTALDAYWORE 23.50 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 30740 Barrels ROTATE 127

MUD lECORD MUDMATERIALS ISED BIT RECOi D
DEPTH 6728 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 5 6
TIME 21:00 2 Poly plus SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 8.5 Fed Seal MFG Reed Security
VIs 28 1 AL.starate TYPE HPS2X XS25S
WL 80 DAPP TFA Open Open
PV/YP 2 Fe Zan JET Open Open
MBT 1 KW SERIALNo. ER20095 10731349
cA 20 1 Fed 744 DEPN OUT 6728
GELS Oug DEPTHIN 6154 6728
ALX .0/0.2 1 C-325 TOTALFEET 574
pH 7.5 5 MaxGel HRS 23.50
CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G 3-BR,CT/1/2-W

CL 600 DAILYCOST $5,120.00 WT. ON Brr 32-35K
DAPP 8.0% PREVIOUSCOST RPM 50/128
%SOLIDs 1.00 CUMULATIVECOST $48,223.00 ROP(fph) 24.4

DRH iniG ASSE IBLY PUMP I ATA DEVIA
NO. DESCMPHON LENGHi - FT PU IP NO. 1 2 DEPTH WiihmiiMB

1 MOTOR 23.37 MODEL 8P80 8PSO 6728' .3

1 PONYNMDC 10.00 sTRoKE 8.50 8.50
IJIV.UF0lL,GA3&

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
ŒASEMME &WRL NO. RED DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Gear Creak September 5, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE DAY NO.

Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Emery Utah 34
(OTALDEPU Rot His aan Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEORIRED MST CASINGSIZE,WHGRF, GRADE SEr O Report No.

6728' 5.5 220 115' 9 5/8" 36# .3-55 3890.61 RBK 34
ACTIVI1YATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Orc Wellbore C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
REMARKS KBTOGL

Broke Circ Out Of intermedit te 10' Flare 10,336 Units Gas For 15-Min 15
TIME LO3

ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:30 1.50 Drill Actuall 6613'-6659'
7:30 8:00 0.50 Survey
8:00 12:00 4.00 Drill Actual/ 6659'41728'l Differiential Spiking Prepare To TOOH
12:00 14:00 2.00 Lost Returns Circ. Stms. Up/ Regained Circ. Circ. Stms Up
14:00 14:30 0.50 Circ Fluid Through String & Up To Shoe/ With Air Off
14:30 22:30 8.00 TOOH For Bit #5 & Inspect Mud Mtr.
22:30 23:00 0.50 Layed Down Mud Motor/Pick Up Mud Motor &Bit
23:00 23:30 0.50 Repair Compound Chain
23:30 0:00 0.50 Function Test BOP'S
0:00 1:00 1.00 Scribe Directional Tools
1:00 4:30 3.50 TIH W/ Bit #6 To 3960'
4:30 6:00 1.50 PU Kelly & Break Circ/ Circ Gas Out Of Well Bore 10,336 Units 10' High Flare For 15 Min

Total iars 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USI I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair 0.50 FUEL USED 650/950 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 178

Hrs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 600 in 0 O DOWN 113
TOTALDAYWORE 23.50 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 30740 Barrels ROTATE 127

MUD lECORD MUDMATERIALS ISED BIT RECOi D
DEPTH 6728 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 5 6
TIME 21:00 2 Poly plus SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 8.5 Fed Seal MFG Reed Security
VIs 28 1 AL.starate TYPE HPS2X XS25S
WL 80 DAPP TFA Open Open
PV/YP 2 Fe Zan JET Open Open
MBT 1 KW SERIALNo. ER20095 10731349
cA 20 1 Fed 744 DEPN OUT 6728
GELS Oug DEPTHIN 6154 6728
ALX .0/0.2 1 C-325 TOTALFEET 574
pH 7.5 5 MaxGel HRS 23.50
CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G 3-BR,CT/1/2-W

CL 600 DAILYCOST $5,120.00 WT. ON Brr 32-35K
DAPP 8.0% PREVIOUSCOST RPM 50/128
%SOLIDs 1.00 CUMULATIVECOST $48,223.00 ROP(fph) 24.4

DRH iniG ASSE IBLY PUMP I ATA DEVIA
NO. DESCMPHON LENGHi - FT PU IP NO. 1 2 DEPTH WiihmiiMB

1 MOTOR 23.37 MODEL 8P80 8PSO 6728' .3

1 PONYNMDC 10.00 sTRoKE 8.50 8.50
IJIV.UF0lL,GA3&

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
ŒASEMME &WRL NO. RED DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Gear Creak September 5, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE DAY NO.

Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Emery Utah 34
(OTALDEPU Rot His aan Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEORIRED MST CASINGSIZE,WHGRF, GRADE SEr O Report No.

6728' 5.5 220 115' 9 5/8" 36# .3-55 3890.61 RBK 34
ACTIVI1YATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Orc Wellbore C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
REMARKS KBTOGL

Broke Circ Out Of intermedit te 10' Flare 10,336 Units Gas For 15-Min 15
TIME LO3

ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:30 1.50 Drill Actuall 6613'-6659'
7:30 8:00 0.50 Survey
8:00 12:00 4.00 Drill Actual/ 6659'41728'l Differiential Spiking Prepare To TOOH
12:00 14:00 2.00 Lost Returns Circ. Stms. Up/ Regained Circ. Circ. Stms Up
14:00 14:30 0.50 Circ Fluid Through String & Up To Shoe/ With Air Off
14:30 22:30 8.00 TOOH For Bit #5 & Inspect Mud Mtr.
22:30 23:00 0.50 Layed Down Mud Motor/Pick Up Mud Motor &Bit
23:00 23:30 0.50 Repair Compound Chain
23:30 0:00 0.50 Function Test BOP'S
0:00 1:00 1.00 Scribe Directional Tools
1:00 4:30 3.50 TIH W/ Bit #6 To 3960'
4:30 6:00 1.50 PU Kelly & Break Circ/ Circ Gas Out Of Well Bore 10,336 Units 10' High Flare For 15 Min

Total iars 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USI I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair 0.50 FUEL USED 650/950 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 178

Hrs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 600 in 0 O DOWN 113
TOTALDAYWORE 23.50 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 30740 Barrels ROTATE 127

MUD lECORD MUDMATERIALS ISED BIT RECOi D
DEPTH 6728 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 5 6
TIME 21:00 2 Poly plus SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 8.5 Fed Seal MFG Reed Security
VIs 28 1 AL.starate TYPE HPS2X XS25S
WL 80 DAPP TFA Open Open
PV/YP 2 Fe Zan JET Open Open
MBT 1 KW SERIALNo. ER20095 10731349
cA 20 1 Fed 744 DEPN OUT 6728
GELS Oug DEPTHIN 6154 6728
ALX .0/0.2 1 C-325 TOTALFEET 574
pH 7.5 5 MaxGel HRS 23.50
CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G 3-BR,CT/1/2-W

CL 600 DAILYCOST $5,120.00 WT. ON Brr 32-35K
DAPP 8.0% PREVIOUSCOST RPM 50/128
%SOLIDs 1.00 CUMULATIVECOST $48,223.00 ROP(fph) 24.4

DRH iniG ASSE IBLY PUMP I ATA DEVIA
NO. DESCMPHON LENGHi - FT PU IP NO. 1 2 DEPTH WiihmiiMB

1 MOTOR 23.37 MODEL 8P80 8PSO 6728' .3

1 PONYNMDC 10.00 sTRoKE 8.50 8.50
IJIV.UF0lL,GA3&



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASEWAMERWELLNO. FIELD DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak September 4, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUN1Y SIATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling corp.Rig 132 Emery Utah 33
(OTALOGRH R Hm om M His fDUTAGEORIUÆD UST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET O Regat No.

6613 18 214.5 459' 9 5|8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 33
ACTIVHYATREPORETIME REPORTEDSY

DrillActual ¡C.E.Crow/R. M. Crow
REERKS KBTOGL.

15
TIME lß3

mon to nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 Repair Rotary Clutch
7:00 8:00 1.00 Wash & Ream 100' To Btm.
8:00 8:30 0.50 Drill Actual/ 6154'-6189'
8:30 9:00 0.50 Survey
9:00 12:00 3.00 DrillActual/ 6189'-6283'
12:00 12:30 0.50 Survey
12:30 14:00 1.50 Sliding/6283'-6297'I Drill Actual/ 629T-6315'

14:00 14:30 0.50 Rig Service
14:30 16:00 1.50 Drill Actu all 8315'-6378'
16:00 16:30 0.50 Survey
16:30 21:00 4.50 Drill Actual /6378'-6481'
21:00 21:30 0.50 Survey
21:30 23:00 1.50 Sliding/6481'-6496'lDrillActual/ 6496'-6505' ECENED
23:00 0:00 1.00 Replace Rotary Chain
0:00 2:30 2.50 Drill Actuall 6505'-6565'
2:30 3:00 0.50 Survey
3:00 6:00 3.00 Drill Actual/6565'-6588'l Sliding/ 6575'-6588'l DrillActual/8588'-6613'

gy Ut-0\L,CADMINING

Total Lours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 2.00 FUEL USED 650/950 Gallons Boller Hours NA UP 178
Hrs. Mob./Demok 0,00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 In 0 Out DOWN 113
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 22.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 127

MUD lECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEFTH 6176 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNo. 5 5
TIME 8:00 1 Poly plus SIZE S 3/4
WEIGHT 7.5 Fed Seal MFG Smitil
VIs 29 AL. $terdte TYPE HP52X
WL DAPP TFA Open
PV/YP 2 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 1 K-600 SERIALNo. ER20095
CA 15 KwikPlug DEPTHOUT 6613
GELS Duragel OEFTHIN 6154
ALK 0.0/0.3 Asphasol TOTALFEET 459
pH 7 4 MaxGel HRS 18.ÛÛ
CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G

CL 800 DAILYCOST $1,918.00 Wr. ON BrT 32-35K

DAPP 6.0% PREVIOUSCOST RPM 50/128
%souns 0.38 CUMULATIVECOST ‡43,103.00 ROP(fph) 25.5

DRILLING ASSE JiBLY PUMP f ATA MEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCRIPHON LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPM Inclinaden / Azimuth

1 BIT 1.00 MAiŒ Nat Nat 6140' 40.6/296

1 MOTOR 23.37 MODEL 8P80 8P80 6234' 39.9/296.6
1 PONYNMDC 10.00 SROKE 8.50 8.50 6329'

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASEWAMERWELLNO. FIELD DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak September 4, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUN1Y SIATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling corp.Rig 132 Emery Utah 33
(OTALOGRH R Hm om M His fDUTAGEORIUÆD UST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET O Regat No.

6613 18 214.5 459' 9 5|8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 33
ACTIVHYATREPORETIME REPORTEDSY

DrillActual ¡C.E.Crow/R. M. Crow
REERKS KBTOGL.

15
TIME lß3

mon to nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 Repair Rotary Clutch
7:00 8:00 1.00 Wash & Ream 100' To Btm.
8:00 8:30 0.50 Drill Actual/ 6154'-6189'
8:30 9:00 0.50 Survey
9:00 12:00 3.00 DrillActual/ 6189'-6283'
12:00 12:30 0.50 Survey
12:30 14:00 1.50 Sliding/6283'-6297'I Drill Actual/ 629T-6315'

14:00 14:30 0.50 Rig Service
14:30 16:00 1.50 Drill Actu all 8315'-6378'
16:00 16:30 0.50 Survey
16:30 21:00 4.50 Drill Actual /6378'-6481'
21:00 21:30 0.50 Survey
21:30 23:00 1.50 Sliding/6481'-6496'lDrillActual/ 6496'-6505' ECENED
23:00 0:00 1.00 Replace Rotary Chain
0:00 2:30 2.50 Drill Actuall 6505'-6565'
2:30 3:00 0.50 Survey
3:00 6:00 3.00 Drill Actual/6565'-6588'l Sliding/ 6575'-6588'l DrillActual/8588'-6613'

gy Ut-0\L,CADMINING

Total Lours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 2.00 FUEL USED 650/950 Gallons Boller Hours NA UP 178

Hrs. Mob./Demok 0,00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 In 0 Out DOWN 113
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 22.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 127

MUD lECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEFTH 6176 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNo. 5 5
TIME 8:00 1 Poly plus SIZE S 3/4
WEIGHT 7.5 Fed Seal MFG Smitil
VIs 29 AL. $terdte TYPE HP52X
WL DAPP TFA Open

PV/YP 2 Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT 1 K-600 SERIALNo. ER20095
CA 15 KwikPlug DEPTHOUT 6613
GELS Duragel OEFTHIN 6154
ALK 0.0/0.3 Asphasol TOTALFEET 459
pH 7 4 MaxGel HRS 18.ÛÛ
CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G

CL 800 DAILYCOST $1,918.00 Wr. ON BrT 32-35K

DAPP 6.0% PREVIOUSCOST RPM 50/128
%souns 0.38 CUMULATIVECOST ‡43,103.00 ROP(fph) 25.5

DRILLING ASSE JiBLY PUMP f ATA MEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCRIPHON LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPM Inclinaden / Azimuth

1 BIT 1.00 MAiŒ Nat Nat 6140' 40.6/296

1 MOTOR 23.37 MODEL 8P80 8P80 6234' 39.9/296.6
1 PONYNMDC 10.00 SROKE 8.50 8.50 6329'

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASEWAMERWELLNO. FIELD DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak September 4, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUN1Y SIATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling corp.Rig 132 Emery Utah 33
(OTALOGRH R Hm om M His fDUTAGEORIUÆD UST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET O Regat No.

6613 18 214.5 459' 9 5|8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 33
ACTIVHYATREPORETIME REPORTEDSY

DrillActual ¡C.E.Crow/R. M. Crow
REERKS KBTOGL.

15
TIME lß3

mon to nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 Repair Rotary Clutch
7:00 8:00 1.00 Wash & Ream 100' To Btm.
8:00 8:30 0.50 Drill Actual/ 6154'-6189'
8:30 9:00 0.50 Survey
9:00 12:00 3.00 DrillActual/ 6189'-6283'
12:00 12:30 0.50 Survey
12:30 14:00 1.50 Sliding/6283'-6297'I Drill Actual/ 629T-6315'

14:00 14:30 0.50 Rig Service
14:30 16:00 1.50 Drill Actu all 8315'-6378'
16:00 16:30 0.50 Survey
16:30 21:00 4.50 Drill Actual /6378'-6481'
21:00 21:30 0.50 Survey
21:30 23:00 1.50 Sliding/6481'-6496'lDrillActual/ 6496'-6505' ECENED
23:00 0:00 1.00 Replace Rotary Chain
0:00 2:30 2.50 Drill Actuall 6505'-6565'
2:30 3:00 0.50 Survey
3:00 6:00 3.00 Drill Actual/6565'-6588'l Sliding/ 6575'-6588'l DrillActual/8588'-6613'

gy Ut-0\L,CADMINING

Total Lours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 2.00 FUEL USED 650/950 Gallons Boller Hours NA UP 178

Hrs. Mob./Demok 0,00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 In 0 Out DOWN 113
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 22.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 127

MUD lECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEFTH 6176 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNo. 5 5
TIME 8:00 1 Poly plus SIZE S 3/4
WEIGHT 7.5 Fed Seal MFG Smitil
VIs 29 AL. $terdte TYPE HP52X
WL DAPP TFA Open

PV/YP 2 Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT 1 K-600 SERIALNo. ER20095
CA 15 KwikPlug DEPTHOUT 6613
GELS Duragel OEFTHIN 6154
ALK 0.0/0.3 Asphasol TOTALFEET 459
pH 7 4 MaxGel HRS 18.ÛÛ
CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G

CL 800 DAILYCOST $1,918.00 Wr. ON BrT 32-35K

DAPP 6.0% PREVIOUSCOST RPM 50/128
%souns 0.38 CUMULATIVECOST ‡43,103.00 ROP(fph) 25.5

DRILLING ASSE JiBLY PUMP f ATA MEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCRIPHON LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPM Inclinaden / Azimuth

1 BIT 1.00 MAiŒ Nat Nat 6140' 40.6/296

1 MOTOR 23.37 MODEL 8P80 8P80 6234' 39.9/296.6
1 PONYNMDC 10.00 SROKE 8.50 8.50 6329'



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LMSEMME R WEU. NO. HRD DAFE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak September 3, 2007
SIG NMIEMID NUMBER COUNTY STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emerf Utah 32
lUTAI.DEPHI Rat.Nis cumRot.Hrs FOGTAGEORILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SETO ReportNo.

6154' 3 196.5 154' j9 5/8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 32
tvrYAf RBURTTIME REPORTEDBY

Repairing Rotary Clutch ¡C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

Pumped 1200bbis Fluid WI 1300cfm Before Est Retums 15
TIME LOG

mose To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:30 1.50 Drill Actuall 6000'4010'I Sliding/ 6010'-6012'I DriftActual/ 6012'-6094°

7:30 8:00 0.50 Surveys
8:00 9:30 1.50 Drill Actual/ 6094'-6104'I Sliding/ 6104'-6125'I Drill Actuall 6125'4164'
9:30 10:30 1.00 Circulate Btms. Up
10:30 11:30 1.00 TripOut OfHole
11:30 12:30 1.00 Float Opened BlowingAirOut Top Of DrillPipe/ Kelly Up &Load Hole With Fluid
12:30 15:00 2.50 Trip Out Of Hole
15:00 15:30 0.50 Pull Roating Head Rubber
15:30 18:00 2.50 Trip Out Of Hole
18:00 19:30 1.50 Break Bit LD Mud Mtr.I Make Up Bit Install New Mud Mtr & Change Out Dir. Tools/ Scribe
19:30 21:00 1.50 TIH WI BHA
21:00 22:30 1.50 Slip & Cut 100' Of DrillingLine
22:30 2:30 4.00 TIHI To 5966'
2:30 6:00 3.50 Pumped 400bbis Fluid No Returns WI1800cfm/ LD 2-Jts DPI Pump 800bbis WI1800cfŠ¾s

SEP1 3 2007
DIV.0F0lL,GAS&MINING

Total I ours 24.00 FUEL ANDWATER USE I BOILERHOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 672/500 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 178
Hrs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bb1s. Water hauled last 24 hours 270 inj 0 O DOWN 113
TOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 127

MUD (ECORD MUDMATERIALS1ISED BIT RECOED
DEFm 6154 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 4 5
TIME 21:00 Poly plus SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4"
WEIGHT 8.5 Fed Seal MFG Smitft REED
VIs 28 1 AL.Sterate TYPE M516LKHPX HP52X
Wl. 80 DAPP TFA 1.63 Open
PVfYP 2 Fed-Zan JET 3x20/2x18/2x13 Open
MBT 1 K-600 SERIALNo. ER20095 KA9978
CA 20 KwikPlug DEPTHout 6154
SEls Duragel DEPTNIN 3915 6154
ALK .0/.25

Asphasol TOTALFEET 2239 0
pH 7 2 MaxGel HRs 54.25 0.00
CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G 0/0/0

CL 400 DAILYcosT $2,611.00 WT.ON BIT 8-12K

DAPP 0.090 PREVIOUSCOST RPM 50/128
%souns 0% CUMULATIVECOST $41,185.00 RDPgph) 41.3

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP i ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
NO. DESCMPTION I.ENGTH -FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEP1H TM / AM

1 BIT 1.00 MANE Nat Nat 5763' 41.1/296.3
1 MOTOR 23.37 MODEL 8P80 8P80 5856' 39.8/294.5
1 PONYNMDC 10.00 SmOKE 8.50 8.50 5951'

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LMSEMME R WEU. NO. HRD DAFE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak September 3, 2007
SIG NMIEMID NUMBER COUNTY STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emerf Utah 32
lUTAI.DEPHI Rat.Nis cumRot.Hrs FOGTAGEORILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SETO ReportNo.

6154' 3 196.5 154' j9 5/8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 32
tvrYAf RBURTTIME REPORTEDBY

Repairing Rotary Clutch ¡C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

Pumped 1200bbis Fluid WI 1300cfm Before Est Retums 15
TIME LOG

mose To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:30 1.50 Drill Actuall 6000'4010'I Sliding/ 6010'-6012'I DriftActual/ 6012'-6094°

7:30 8:00 0.50 Surveys
8:00 9:30 1.50 Drill Actual/ 6094'-6104'I Sliding/ 6104'-6125'I Drill Actuall 6125'4164'
9:30 10:30 1.00 Circulate Btms. Up
10:30 11:30 1.00 TripOut OfHole
11:30 12:30 1.00 Float Opened BlowingAirOut Top Of DrillPipe/ Kelly Up &Load Hole With Fluid
12:30 15:00 2.50 Trip Out Of Hole
15:00 15:30 0.50 Pull Roating Head Rubber
15:30 18:00 2.50 Trip Out Of Hole
18:00 19:30 1.50 Break Bit LD Mud Mtr.I Make Up Bit Install New Mud Mtr & Change Out Dir. Tools/ Scribe
19:30 21:00 1.50 TIH WI BHA
21:00 22:30 1.50 Slip & Cut 100' Of DrillingLine
22:30 2:30 4.00 TIHI To 5966'
2:30 6:00 3.50 Pumped 400bbis Fluid No Returns WI1800cfm/ LD 2-Jts DPI Pump 800bbis WI1800cfŠ¾s

SEP1 3 2007
DIV.0F0lL,GAS&MINING

Total I ours 24.00 FUEL ANDWATER USE I BOILERHOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 672/500 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 178
Hrs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bb1s. Water hauled last 24 hours 270 inj 0 O DOWN 113
TOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 127

MUD (ECORD MUDMATERIALS1ISED BIT RECOED
DEFm 6154 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 4 5
TIME 21:00 Poly plus SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4"
WEIGHT 8.5 Fed Seal MFG Smitft REED
VIs 28 1 AL.Sterate TYPE M516LKHPX HP52X
Wl. 80 DAPP TFA 1.63 Open
PVfYP 2 Fed-Zan JET 3x20/2x18/2x13 Open
MBT 1 K-600 SERIALNo. ER20095 KA9978
CA 20 KwikPlug DEPTHout 6154
SEls Duragel DEPTNIN 3915 6154
ALK .0/.25

Asphasol TOTALFEET 2239 0
pH 7 2 MaxGel HRs 54.25 0.00
CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G 0/0/0

CL 400 DAILYcosT $2,611.00 WT.ON BIT 8-12K

DAPP 0.090 PREVIOUSCOST RPM 50/128
%souns 0% CUMULATIVECOST $41,185.00 RDPgph) 41.3

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP i ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
NO. DESCMPTION I.ENGTH -FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEP1H TM / AM

1 BIT 1.00 MANE Nat Nat 5763' 41.1/296.3
1 MOTOR 23.37 MODEL 8P80 8P80 5856' 39.8/294.5
1 PONYNMDC 10.00 SmOKE 8.50 8.50 5951'

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LMSEMME R WEU. NO. HRD DAFE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak September 3, 2007
SIG NMIEMID NUMBER COUNTY STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emerf Utah 32
lUTAI.DEPHI Rat.Nis cumRot.Hrs FOGTAGEORILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SETO ReportNo.

6154' 3 196.5 154' j9 5/8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 32
tvrYAf RBURTTIME REPORTEDBY

Repairing Rotary Clutch ¡C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

Pumped 1200bbis Fluid WI 1300cfm Before Est Retums 15
TIME LOG

mose To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:30 1.50 Drill Actuall 6000'4010'I Sliding/ 6010'-6012'I DriftActual/ 6012'-6094°

7:30 8:00 0.50 Surveys
8:00 9:30 1.50 Drill Actual/ 6094'-6104'I Sliding/ 6104'-6125'I Drill Actuall 6125'4164'
9:30 10:30 1.00 Circulate Btms. Up
10:30 11:30 1.00 TripOut OfHole
11:30 12:30 1.00 Float Opened BlowingAirOut Top Of DrillPipe/ Kelly Up &Load Hole With Fluid
12:30 15:00 2.50 Trip Out Of Hole
15:00 15:30 0.50 Pull Roating Head Rubber
15:30 18:00 2.50 Trip Out Of Hole
18:00 19:30 1.50 Break Bit LD Mud Mtr.I Make Up Bit Install New Mud Mtr & Change Out Dir. Tools/ Scribe
19:30 21:00 1.50 TIH WI BHA
21:00 22:30 1.50 Slip & Cut 100' Of DrillingLine
22:30 2:30 4.00 TIHI To 5966'
2:30 6:00 3.50 Pumped 400bbis Fluid No Returns WI1800cfm/ LD 2-Jts DPI Pump 800bbis WI1800cfŠ¾s

SEP1 3 2007
DIV.0F0lL,GAS&MINING

Total I ours 24.00 FUEL ANDWATER USE I BOILERHOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 672/500 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 178
Hrs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bb1s. Water hauled last 24 hours 270 inj 0 O DOWN 113
TOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 127

MUD (ECORD MUDMATERIALS1ISED BIT RECOED
DEFm 6154 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 4 5
TIME 21:00 Poly plus SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4"
WEIGHT 8.5 Fed Seal MFG Smitft REED
VIs 28 1 AL.Sterate TYPE M516LKHPX HP52X
Wl. 80 DAPP TFA 1.63 Open
PVfYP 2 Fed-Zan JET 3x20/2x18/2x13 Open
MBT 1 K-600 SERIALNo. ER20095 KA9978
CA 20 KwikPlug DEPTHout 6154
SEls Duragel DEPTNIN 3915 6154
ALK .0/.25

Asphasol TOTALFEET 2239 0
pH 7 2 MaxGel HRs 54.25 0.00
CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G 0/0/0

CL 400 DAILYcosT $2,611.00 WT.ON BIT 8-12K

DAPP 0.090 PREVIOUSCOST RPM 50/128
%souns 0% CUMULATIVECOST $41,185.00 RDPgph) 41.3

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP i ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
NO. DESCMPTION I.ENGTH -FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEP1H TM / AM

1 BIT 1.00 MANE Nat Nat 5763' 41.1/296.3
1 MOTOR 23.37 MODEL 8P80 8P80 5856' 39.8/294.5
1 PONYNMDC 10.00 SmOKE 8.50 8.50 5951'



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
U¾E MNERWEU.NO. HED Om

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak September2r 2007
RIGMME ANDNUMBER COUNTY 51ATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Emery Utah 31
TOTALDEPfH Rot. His ctm Rot. His FOOTAGEORILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WSGHT, GRADE SET © Report No.

6000' 20 193.5 922' 9 5/8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 31
Acuvnvar WORTTME RETORTEDSY

Drill Actual |C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
REMARMS KBTOGL.

Hole Tried To Pack Off @5218' 15
TIME LOG

mon to nouns ACTIVITYDETAIL
6:00 7:30 1.50 Drill Actuat/6078'-5153'
7:30 8:00 0.50 Surveys
8:00 8:30 0.50 Drin ActuaV 5153'-5216'
8:30 9:00 0.50 Rig Service
9:00 10:00 1.00 Drill Actual/5216'-5248'
10:00 11:30 1.50 Charger Pump & Mud Pump Aired Up/ DifferientialSpike &Hole Paking Off
11:30 12:00 0.50 Surveys
12:00 16:00 4.00 DrillActual/5342'-5436'
16:00 16:30 0.50 Surveys
16:30 DrillActuall 5436'-5456YSliding/ 5436'-5456'l Drill Actuall 5456'-5718YSiiding/5718'-5728'

Drill Actual/5728'-5823'ISliding/5823'-58339DrillActual/5833'-5904YSliding/5904'-5924'
5:30 13.00 Drill Actual/5924'-ß000' DECEIVED

5:30 6:00 0.50 Surveys

SEP1 32007

DW.0EOlL,GA3&Ml!Jll'O

Total Idours 24.00 FUEL AND WATERUSE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 672/1111 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 178
Hrs. Mob.JDemoh 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 90 In 0 Out DOWN 113
TOTAL DAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 90 Barrels ROTATE 127

MUD (ECORD MUD MATERIALSf ISED BIT RECOI D
DEPTH 5241 NO.OF SACKSABS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 4

TIME 10:00 1 Poly plus sizE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 8.5 Fed Seal MFG Smith
vis 30 AL Storate TYPE M516LKHPX
Wl. 40 DAPP TFA 1.63

PvivP s Fed-2an lET 3x20/2x18/2x13

MBT 1 K-600 SERIALNo. ER20095
CA 20 KwikPlug DEVIHOUT 6000
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 3915
ALK Asphasol TOTALFEET 2085
pH 7 9 MaxGel HRs 51.25
CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/8/G

CL ßÛÛ DAILYCOST $2,618.00 WT. ON BIT 8-12K

DAPP 0.070 PREVIOUSCOST RPM 50/128
%SOUDS Ûlo CUMULATIVECOST $38,574.00 RDP(fph) 40.7

DRILLING ASSEl4BLY PUMP LATA MEVIATIONREC )RD

NO. DESCRIPHON LENGHi - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPM Inclinaden / Azimuth

1 BIT 1.00 MAIŒ Nat Wat 5105' 48.8/295.7
1 MOTOR 23.25 MODEL 8P80 SP80 5199' 48.1/295.2
1 DONY NMIT 1û 00 mmnuF 8.50 8.50 5292'

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
U¾E MNERWEU.NO. HED Om

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak September2r 2007
RIGMME ANDNUMBER COUNTY 51ATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Emery Utah 31
TOTALDEPfH Rot. His ctm Rot. His FOOTAGEORILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WSGHT, GRADE SET © Report No.

6000' 20 193.5 922' 9 5/8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 31
Acuvnvar WORTTME RETORTEDSY

Drill Actual |C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
REMARMS KBTOGL.

Hole Tried To Pack Off @5218' 15
TIME LOG

mon to nouns ACTIVITYDETAIL
6:00 7:30 1.50 Drill Actuat/6078'-5153'
7:30 8:00 0.50 Surveys
8:00 8:30 0.50 Drin ActuaV 5153'-5216'
8:30 9:00 0.50 Rig Service
9:00 10:00 1.00 Drill Actual/5216'-5248'
10:00 11:30 1.50 Charger Pump & Mud Pump Aired Up/ DifferientialSpike &Hole Paking Off
11:30 12:00 0.50 Surveys
12:00 16:00 4.00 DrillActual/5342'-5436'
16:00 16:30 0.50 Surveys
16:30 DrillActuall 5436'-5456YSliding/ 5436'-5456'l Drill Actuall 5456'-5718YSiiding/5718'-5728'

Drill Actual/5728'-5823'ISliding/5823'-58339DrillActual/5833'-5904YSliding/5904'-5924'
5:30 13.00 Drill Actual/5924'-ß000' DECEIVED

5:30 6:00 0.50 Surveys

SEP1 32007

DW.0EOlL,GA3&Ml!Jll'O

Total Idours 24.00 FUEL AND WATERUSE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 672/1111 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 178
Hrs. Mob.JDemoh 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 90 In 0 Out DOWN 113
TOTAL DAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 90 Barrels ROTATE 127

MUD (ECORD MUD MATERIALSf ISED BIT RECOI D
DEPTH 5241 NO.OF SACKSABS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 4

TIME 10:00 1 Poly plus sizE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 8.5 Fed Seal MFG Smith
vis 30 AL Storate TYPE M516LKHPX
Wl. 40 DAPP TFA 1.63

PvivP s Fed-2an lET 3x20/2x18/2x13

MBT 1 K-600 SERIALNo. ER20095
CA 20 KwikPlug DEVIHOUT 6000
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 3915
ALK Asphasol TOTALFEET 2085
pH 7 9 MaxGel HRs 51.25
CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/8/G

CL ßÛÛ DAILYCOST $2,618.00 WT. ON BIT 8-12K

DAPP 0.070 PREVIOUSCOST RPM 50/128
%SOUDS Ûlo CUMULATIVECOST $38,574.00 RDP(fph) 40.7

DRILLING ASSEl4BLY PUMP LATA MEVIATIONREC )RD

NO. DESCRIPHON LENGHi - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPM Inclinaden / Azimuth

1 BIT 1.00 MAIŒ Nat Wat 5105' 48.8/295.7
1 MOTOR 23.25 MODEL 8P80 SP80 5199' 48.1/295.2
1 DONY NMIT 1û 00 mmnuF 8.50 8.50 5292'



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
iBSEMMERWEU.NO. HRD Om

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak September 1, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY ETATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Emery Utah 30
IUTALOEPEN Rat His cum Rat. Hrs 600TAGEORILLED LA5r CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SETO Report No.

5078' 20.25 173.3 835' 9 5/8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 30
AcuvrYAf MSORTTME REPORTEDBY

Drill Actual C.E. Crow/ R. M.Crow
REMARMS KBTOGL.

Tight Hole @4467'/ Pump S veeps & Back Ream out 15
TIME LOG

mon lo nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 DrillActuall 4243'-43167Sliding/4316'4331'lDrill Actual/4331'-4409'I Sliding/4409'-4421'

12:00 6.00 DrillActual/4421'-4493'
12:00 12:30 0.50 Rig Service
12:30 13:00 0.50 Rip Repair Work On Kelly Spinners
13:00 14:45 1.75 Work fight Hole (ED44ð7Y Hole Packing Off From Water Flow/Pump Sweeps & Back Ream Out
14:45 Driti ActuaV4493'-4503/ Sliding/ 4503'-4523'I Drill Actual/ 4523'4692'I Sliding/ 4692'-470TI

1:00 10.25 Drill ActuaU 470T-4870'
1:00 1:30 0.50 Surveys
1:30 Drit! ActuaW4870'-4890'1Sliding/ 4890'-4905'I Drill ActuaW4905'-4974'ISliding/ 4974'-4994'

6:00 4.50 DrillActual/4994'-5058'ISliding/5058'-6078'

HECEIVED
SEP1 32007

DW,DEUIL,GA3&MIMC

Total I oum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair 0.50 FUEL USED 456/855 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 142

Hm. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 90 In 0 O DOWN 80
TOTALDAYWORI¢ 23.50 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 3780 Barrels ROTATE 106

MUD tg00RD MUDMATERIALS ISED BIT RECOFD
DEPTH 4753 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNO. 4
TIME 21:00 Poly plus SIZE 8 3/4
WBGHT 7.6 Fed Seal MFG Smith
VIS 29 AL.Sterate TYPE M516LKHPX
wt 440 DAPP TFA 1.63
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET 3x20/2x18/2x13
MBT 1 K-600 SERIALNO. ER20095
CA 20 KwikPlug DEPTH041T 5078
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 3915
ALK Asphasol TOTALFEET 1163
pH 7 MaxGet HRs 31.25
CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G

CL 600 DAILYCOST $11,000.00 WT. ON BIT 8-12K
DAPP 0.090 PREVIOUSCOST RPM 50/128
%souns 0% CUMULATIVECOST $35,956.00 RDP(fph) 37.2

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP f ATA MEVIATIONREC)RD
NOW DESCRIPFION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPui IncBnaden / AM=Mi

1 BIT 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 4257' 41.6/292.5
1 MOTOR 23.25 MODEL 8P80 8PSO 4350' 43.0/292
1 PONY NMIX" 10.00 STROKE 8.50 8.50 4445'

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
iBSEMMERWEU.NO. HRD Om

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak September 1, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY ETATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Emery Utah 30
IUTALOEPEN Rat His cum Rat. Hrs 600TAGEORILLED LA5r CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SETO Report No.

5078' 20.25 173.3 835' 9 5/8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 30
AcuvrYAf MSORTTME REPORTEDBY

Drill Actual C.E. Crow/ R. M.Crow
REMARMS KBTOGL.

Tight Hole @4467'/ Pump S veeps & Back Ream out 15
TIME LOG

mon lo nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 DrillActuall 4243'-43167Sliding/4316'4331'lDrill Actual/4331'-4409'I Sliding/4409'-4421'

12:00 6.00 DrillActual/4421'-4493'
12:00 12:30 0.50 Rig Service
12:30 13:00 0.50 Rip Repair Work On Kelly Spinners
13:00 14:45 1.75 Work fight Hole (ED44ð7Y Hole Packing Off From Water Flow/Pump Sweeps & Back Ream Out
14:45 Driti ActuaV4493'-4503/ Sliding/ 4503'-4523'I Drill Actual/ 4523'4692'I Sliding/ 4692'-470TI

1:00 10.25 Drill ActuaU 470T-4870'
1:00 1:30 0.50 Surveys
1:30 Drit! ActuaW4870'-4890'1Sliding/ 4890'-4905'I Drill ActuaW4905'-4974'ISliding/ 4974'-4994'

6:00 4.50 DrillActual/4994'-5058'ISliding/5058'-6078'

HECEIVED

SEP1 32007

DW,DEUIL,GA3&MIMC

Total I oum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair 0.50 FUEL USED 456/855 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 142

Hm. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 90 In 0 O DOWN 80
TOTALDAYWORI¢ 23.50 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 3780 Barrels ROTATE 106

MUD tg00RD MUDMATERIALS ISED BIT RECOFD
DEPTH 4753 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNO. 4
TIME 21:00 Poly plus SIZE 8 3/4
WBGHT 7.6 Fed Seal MFG Smith
VIS 29 AL.Sterate TYPE M516LKHPX
wt 440 DAPP TFA 1.63
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET 3x20/2x18/2x13
MBT 1 K-600 SERIALNO. ER20095
CA 20 KwikPlug DEPTH041T 5078
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 3915
ALK Asphasol TOTALFEET 1163
pH 7 MaxGet HRs 31.25
CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G

CL 600 DAILYCOST $11,000.00 WT. ON BIT 8-12K
DAPP 0.090 PREVIOUSCOST RPM 50/128
%souns 0% CUMULATIVECOST $35,956.00 RDP(fph) 37.2

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP f ATA MEVIATIONREC)RD
NOW DESCRIPFION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPui IncBnaden / AM=Mi

1 BIT 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 4257' 41.6/292.5
1 MOTOR 23.25 MODEL 8P80 8PSO 4350' 43.0/292
1 PONY NMIX" 10.00 STROKE 8.50 8.50 4445'

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
iBSEMMERWEU.NO. HRD Om

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear creak September 1, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY ETATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Emery Utah 30
IUTALOEPEN Rat His cum Rat. Hrs 600TAGEORILLED LA5r CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SETO Report No.

5078' 20.25 173.3 835' 9 5/8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 30
AcuvrYAf MSORTTME REPORTEDBY

Drill Actual C.E. Crow/ R. M.Crow
REMARMS KBTOGL.

Tight Hole @4467'/ Pump S veeps & Back Ream out 15
TIME LOG

mon lo nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 DrillActuall 4243'-43167Sliding/4316'4331'lDrill Actual/4331'-4409'I Sliding/4409'-4421'

12:00 6.00 DrillActual/4421'-4493'
12:00 12:30 0.50 Rig Service
12:30 13:00 0.50 Rip Repair Work On Kelly Spinners
13:00 14:45 1.75 Work fight Hole (ED44ð7Y Hole Packing Off From Water Flow/Pump Sweeps & Back Ream Out
14:45 Driti ActuaV4493'-4503/ Sliding/ 4503'-4523'I Drill Actual/ 4523'4692'I Sliding/ 4692'-470TI

1:00 10.25 Drill ActuaU 470T-4870'
1:00 1:30 0.50 Surveys
1:30 Drit! ActuaW4870'-4890'1Sliding/ 4890'-4905'I Drill ActuaW4905'-4974'ISliding/ 4974'-4994'

6:00 4.50 DrillActual/4994'-5058'ISliding/5058'-6078'

HECEIVED

SEP1 32007

DW,DEUIL,GA3&MIMC

Total I oum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair 0.50 FUEL USED 456/855 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 142

Hm. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 90 In 0 O DOWN 80
TOTALDAYWORI¢ 23.50 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 3780 Barrels ROTATE 106

MUD tg00RD MUDMATERIALS ISED BIT RECOFD
DEPTH 4753 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNO. 4
TIME 21:00 Poly plus SIZE 8 3/4
WBGHT 7.6 Fed Seal MFG Smith
VIS 29 AL.Sterate TYPE M516LKHPX
wt 440 DAPP TFA 1.63
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET 3x20/2x18/2x13
MBT 1 K-600 SERIALNO. ER20095
CA 20 KwikPlug DEPTH041T 5078
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 3915
ALK Asphasol TOTALFEET 1163
pH 7 MaxGet HRs 31.25
CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G

CL 600 DAILYCOST $11,000.00 WT. ON BIT 8-12K
DAPP 0.090 PREVIOUSCOST RPM 50/128
%souns 0% CUMULATIVECOST $35,956.00 RDP(fph) 37.2

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP f ATA MEVIATIONREC)RD
NOW DESCRIPFION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPui IncBnaden / AM=Mi

1 BIT 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 4257' 41.6/292.5
1 MOTOR 23.25 MODEL 8P80 8PSO 4350' 43.0/292
1 PONY NMIX" 10.00 STROKE 8.50 8.50 4445'



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
LMSE NME &WEU.No. FIED DATE

Ridge Runner 8-19 Clear Creak August 31, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE DAYNO.

Unit Drilling corp.Rig 132 Emert Utah 29
rerAL DEPfH Rot. Hrs cumRat. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED UtST CASmGSI2E, WEIGHT,GRADE SET© Report No.

4243 10 153 328' 9 5/8" 36# J-55 3890.61 RBK 29
AcrivrY Af REPORFTIME REPORTEDBY

DrillActual C.E. Crowf R. M. Crow
REMARKS KBTOGL.

Drill Out Float Collar @3847'/ Drill Out Cmt Shoe @3890' 15
TIME LOG

mois To Houns
6:00 Unplug Drilling Jars/ Wait On DrillingJars/ Organize Front Yard & Install Safety Cable/ Mix 8-Pa11ets DAPP

15:30 9.50 Circ. Reservel Fix Hydraulic Leak On Ann. Work On Koomey Remote While Wating On Jars
15:30 18:00 2.50 TiH W/ Bit #4
18:00 18:30 0.50 Kelly Up/ Wash To Top of Plug g 3847'
18:30 19:30 1.00 DrillOut Float Collar @3847' & Drill Out Shoe @3890'
19:30 20:00 0.50 Wash &Ream 3890'-3915'
20:00 Drill Actual/ 3915'4024'I Sliding/ 4024'-4044'I Drill Actual/ 4044'-4120'l Sliding/ 4120'-4130'l

6:00 10.00 DrillActual/ 4130'-4243'

Ht-Ut-IVED

SEP1 32007

DN.0FolL,GAba MlNING

Total Cours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.50 FUEL USED 448/447 Gallons Boiler Hours NA P 135
Hm. Mob./Demot 0,00 Bbts. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 In 0 Out OWN 96
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%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $24,956.00 ROP(fph) 32.8

DRÉ.i.ING ASSE ABLY PUMP I ATA
¯

UEVÏATIONRËC)RD

NO. DESCRIFFION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm IncBnaNon / Azimuth
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1 NYNMDC 10.00 smoKE 8.50 8.50 4157
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United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office

P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake Cit:y, Utah 84145-0155

IN REPLY REEER TO:
3160
(UT-922)

October 4, 2007

Memorandum

To: Assistant Field Office Manager Resources,
Moab Field Office

From: Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer

Subject: 2007 Plan of Development Clear Creek Unit
Carbon County, Utah.

Pursuant to email between Eric Jones, Moab Field office, and
Mickey Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land Management,
the wells surface and or bottom hole locations have been
modified. The following are the new locations (see our April 25,
2006 and July 18, 2006 memos for previous locations).

API# WELLNAME LOCATION

43-015-30680 Ridge Runner 1-30 Sec 20 T14S R07E 1514 FSL 1736 FWL

BHL Sec 30 T14S RO7E 1315 FNL 0172 FEL

43-015-30682 Ridge Runner 8-19 Sec 19 T14S RO7E 1513 FSL 1735 FWL

BHL Sec 19 T14S RO7E 2926 FSL 1292 FEL

This office has no objection to permitting the wells at this
time.

/s/ Michael L. Coulthard

bcc: File - Clear Creek Unit
Division of Oil Gas and Mining
Central Files
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron
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NOTICE

Utah Oiland Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-21 states that,

> A well is considered completed when the well has been adequately worked to be capable
of producing oil or gas or when well testing as required by the division is concluded.

> Within 30 days after the completion or plugging of a well, the followingshall be filed:
• Form 8, Well Completion or Recompletion Report and Log
• A copy of electric and radioactivity logs, if run
• A copy of drillstem test reports,
• A copy of formation water analyses, porosity, permeability or fluid saturation

determinations
• A copy of core analyses, and lithologic logs or sample descriptions if compiled
• A copy of directional, deviation, and/or measurement-while-drilling survey for

each horizontal well

Failure to submit reports in a timelymanner willresult in the issuance of a Notice of Violation
by the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, and may result in the Division pursuing enforcement
action as outlined in Rule R649-10, Administrative Procedures, and Section 40-6-11 of the
Utah Code.

As of the mailing of this notice, the division has not received the required reports for

Operator: Marion Energy, Inc Today's Date: 02/14/2008

Well: API Number: Drilling Commenced:

See Attachment

To avoid compliance action, required reports should be mailed within 7 business days to:
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

If you have questions or concerns regarding thismatter, please call (801) 538-5284.

cc: Well File
Compliance
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Well: API Number: Commenced:
Cordingly Cyn 10-1 drlg rpts/wcr 4300731173 05/19/2006
Ballpark Cyn 17-2 drlg rpts/wcr 4300731169 05/30/2006
Alpine School Dist 6-17 drlg rpts/wcr 4300731181 06/26/2006
Alpine School Dist 3-17 drlg rpts/wcr 4300731182 06/26/2006
Kenilworth RR 15-4 drlg rpts/wcr 4300731170 07/05/2006
Kenilworth RR 9-1 drlg rpts/wcr 4300731172 07/06/2006
Ridge Runner 2-19 wcr 4301530684 08/10/2006
Ridge Runner 2-18 drlg rpts/wor 4301530683 08/12/2006
Ridge Runner 8-19 drlg rpts/wcr 4301530682 08/13/2007
Ridge Runner 1-30 drlg rpts/wcr 4301530680
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O
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OlL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

USA-U-01740
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this fonn for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° Clear Creek Unitdrillhorizontallaterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

OILWELL GAS WELL / OTHER Ridge Runner 8-19
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc. 4301530682
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
119 S. Tennessee McKinney

STATE TX ZIP75069 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 15 2.88 ft FSL 17 .25 ft FWL COUNTY: Emery

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:NESW 20 14S 7E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICEOF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstai CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER: Update

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Currently waiting on completion.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Charlotte Parker TITLE Secretary

SIGNATURE DATE 4/4/2008

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
APRi 4 2003

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV.0FOlL,GAS&
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FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 15 2.88 ft FSL 17 .25 ft FWL COUNTY: Emery

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:NESW 20 14S 7E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICEOF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstai CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER: Update

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Currently waiting on completion.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Charlotte Parker TITLE Secretary

SIGNATURE DATE 4/4/2008

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED

APRi 4 2003
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV.0FOlL,GAS&



O
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

USA-U-01740
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° Clear Creek Unitdrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Ridge Runner 8-19
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Marion Energy, Inc. 4301530682
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Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER: Update
5/5/2008 O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

Currently waiting on completion.

NAME(PLEAS RINT) Charlotte Parker TITLE Secretary

SIGNATURE DATE 5/5/2008

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&
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(This space for State use only)
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(This space for State use only)
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(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&



UTAH DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

NOTICE OF REPORTING PROBLEMS

Operator: Marion Energy, Inc Account: N2740 Today's Date: 10/23/2008

Problems:
Failure to submit reports in a timely,accurate, and

Late Report(s) complete manner may result in the issuance of a Notice of
Violation by the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining,and may

result in the Division pursuing enforcement action asInaccurate Report(s) outlined in Rule R649-10, Administrative Procedures, and
Incomplete Report(s) Section 40-6-11 of the Utah Code.

Other. To avoid compliance action, these reporting problems
should be resolved within 7 days.

Send reports to: Fax to: GOT
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (801) 359-3940
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210 Y $~6
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Type of Report Month(s) of Problem Report

Production - Form 10

Disposition - Form 11

Gas Plant - Form 13

Enhanced Recovery - UIC Form 2

Injection - UIC Form 3

Other

Type of Report Well Name(s) API Number(s) Drilling Commenced

Spud Notice - Form 9

Drilling Reports - Form 9

O welicompletionReport - Form 8

Other O List Attached

Description of Problem:

Per R649-3-6 2.4 The operator shall submit a monthly status report for each drillingwell on Form 9, Sundry Notice and
Reports on Wells. The report should include the well depth and a description of the operations conducted on thewell
during the month.

If you have questions or concerns regarding this matter, please contact Rachel Medina at (801) 538-5260
.

cc: Compliance File
RAM
Well File
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UTAH DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

NOTICE OF REPORTING PROBLEMS

ATTACHMENT

Operator: Marion Energy, Inc Account: N2740 Today's Date: 10/23/2008

Well Names API Numbers Drilling Commenced

Cordingly Cyn 10-1 4300731173 05/19/2006

Ballpark Cyn 17-2 4300731169 05/30/2006

Kenilworth Railroad 15-4 4300731170 07/05/2006

Ridge Runner 2-18 4301530683 08/12/2006

Ridge Runner 8-19 4301530682

UTAH DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

NOTICE OF REPORTING PROBLEMS

ATTACHMENT

Operator: Marion Energy, Inc Account: N2740 Today's Date: 10/23/2008

Well Names API Numbers Drilling Commenced
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O
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GASAND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

USA-U-01740
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° Clear Creek Unitdrill horizontal laterais. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL

OIL WELL O GAS WELL O OTHER
NR

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc. 4301530682
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
119 S. Tennessee

CITY McKinney
STATE TX ZIP75069 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 1502.88 ft FSL 1719.25 ft FWL COUNTY: Emery

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:NESW 20 14S 7E STATE:
UTAH

ii. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT S1DETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: Update
11/5/2008 O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Currently waiting on completion.

RECEIVED
NOV1O2008

DIV.0F OIL,GAS&MINING

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Charlotte Parker TITLE Secretary

SIGNATURE DATE 11/5/2008

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse
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(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse
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12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Currently waiting on completion.

RECEIVED
NOV1O2008

DIV.0F OIL,GAS&MINING

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Charlotte Parker TITLE Secretary

SIGNATURE DATE 11/5/2008

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



STATE OF UTAH FORM S
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS ANDMiNING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALMUMBER
USA-U-01740

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 IFINDIAN.ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7 UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:oona ene rormserproposals to do new wer stonigeang deepen exïshng wells below cuiTent bottomdioledepth. teenter plugged wells, odo
driff horizontel laletala Use APPUCATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL formiersuch proposals.

L TYPEOF WELL
OIL WELL Q GAS WELL OTHER

9 n f
2 NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9 API NUMBER:
MarionEnergy 4301530682

3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONENUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL.QR WILDCAT
P.o. Box 1518 , Allen TX 775013 (972) 540-2967 Clear Creek

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1502.88 ft FSL & 1719.25 ft FWL cousTY Emery

QTRIQTR,SECTION. TOWNSHIP,RANGE,MERIDIAm NESW 20 148 7E STATE
UTAH

n CHECKAPPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE,REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ^CIOlZE DEEPEN REPERFORATECURRENT FORMATIONO NOT1CE OF INTENT
<suusa om.> ALTERCMG FRACfURETREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximatedatoworkwills- O CASINGREPAIR O NEWCONSTRUCTION TEWORARUABANDON

O CMNGE TOPRNOUS PUNS O OPERATOR CHANGE TUSNG REM

O CMNGETUSNG NOABANDON VENTORFLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUGBACK WATER DISPOSAL(submîtOriginalFormOrdy)
O CHANGEWELL STATUS PRODUCTiON(START/RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF

Date of workcompletion:

O COMNGLERODUDNGFORMKHONS RECLAMATIONOFWELLSITE OTHER Update
10/2/2012 O CONVERTWELLTYPE O RECOMPLETE-OlFFERENTFORMATION

12 DESCRIBEPROPOSEDOR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinent details inchiding dates, depths, volumes, et

Waitingon completion.

NAMEQUASE PRI Keri Clark

10/2/2012

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See insiructions on Reverse Side)

RECEIVED
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USA-U-01740

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 IFINDIAN.ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7 UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:oona ene rormserproposals to do new wer stonigeang deepen exïshng wells below cuiTent bottomdioledepth. teenter plugged wells, odo
driff horizontel laletala Use APPUCATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL formiersuch proposals.

L TYPEOF WELL
OIL WELL Q GAS WELL OTHER

9 n f
2 NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9 API NUMBER:
MarionEnergy 4301530682

3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONENUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL.QR WILDCAT
P.o. Box 1518 , Allen TX 775013 (972) 540-2967 Clear Creek

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1502.88 ft FSL & 1719.25 ft FWL cousTY Emery

QTRIQTR,SECTION. TOWNSHIP,RANGE,MERIDIAm NESW 20 148 7E STATE
UTAH

n CHECKAPPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE,REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ^CIOlZE DEEPEN REPERFORATECURRENT FORMATIONO NOT1CE OF INTENT
<suusa om.> ALTERCMG FRACfURETREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximatedatoworkwills- O CASINGREPAIR O NEWCONSTRUCTION TEWORARUABANDON

O CMNGE TOPRNOUS PUNS O OPERATOR CHANGE TUSNG REM

O CMNGETUSNG NOABANDON VENTORFLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUGBACK WATER DISPOSAL(submîtOriginalFormOrdy)
O CHANGEWELL STATUS PRODUCTiON(START/RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF

Date of workcompletion:

O COMNGLERODUDNGFORMKHONS RECLAMATIONOFWELLSITE OTHER Update
10/2/2012 O CONVERTWELLTYPE O RECOMPLETE-OlFFERENTFORMATION

12 DESCRIBEPROPOSEDOR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinent details inchiding dates, depths, volumes, et

Waitingon completion.

NAMEQUASE PRI Keri Clark

10/2/2012

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See insiructions on Reverse Side)

RECEIVED
3 OCT 2012

DIV. OF OIL, GAS AND



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use thisform for proposals to drill new wells,significantlydeepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or todrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRlLLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER
Ridge Runner 8-19

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR:
9. API NUMBER

Marion Energy, Inc. 4 30\S 60 %13. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:31 No. Main Street Helper
sTxrE Ut 84526 (435) 650-3923 Clear Creek

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
COUNTY: Û8f OR

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE
UTAH

10 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDRE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON
CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR
CHANGETUBING PLUG AÑDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT4)FFDate of work completion:
O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Ridge Runner 8-19

Casing set throughFerron. Waiting on completion of Ferron.

RECEIVED
APR2 2 2013

OlVOFOIL,GAS&MINING

NAME(PLEASE PRINT)
I¯lax0_Srmith

TITLE Construction/Maintenance/Rclamation

SIGNATURE . , DATE 4/19/2013

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use thisform for proposals to drill new wells,significantlydeepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or todrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRlLLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER
Ridge Runner 8-19

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR:
9. API NUMBER

Marion Energy, Inc. 4 30\S 60 %13. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:31 No. Main Street Helper
sTxrE Ut 84526 (435) 650-3923 Clear Creek

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
COUNTY: Û8f OR

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE
UTAH

10 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDRE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON
CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR
CHANGETUBING PLUG AÑDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT4)FFDate of work completion:
O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Ridge Runner 8-19

Casing set throughFerron. Waiting on completion of Ferron.

RECEIVED
APR2 2 2013

OlVOFOIL,GAS&MINING

NAME(PLEASE PRINT)
I¯lax0_Srmith

TITLE Construction/Maintenance/Rclamation

SIGNATURE . , DATE 4/19/2013

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use thisform for proposals to drill new wells,significantlydeepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or todrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRlLLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER
Ridge Runner 8-19

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR:
9. API NUMBER

Marion Energy, Inc. 4 30\S 60 %13. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:31 No. Main Street Helper
sTxrE Ut 84526 (435) 650-3923 Clear Creek

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
COUNTY: Û8f OR

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE
UTAH

10 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDRE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON
CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR
CHANGETUBING PLUG AÑDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT4)FFDate of work completion:
O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Ridge Runner 8-19

Casing set throughFerron. Waiting on completion of Ferron.

RECEIVED
APR2 2 2013

OlVOFOIL,GAS&MINING

NAME(PLEASE PRINT)
I¯lax0_Srmith

TITLE Construction/Maintenance/Rclamation

SIGNATURE . , DATE 4/19/2013

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



RECEIVED: Jul. 15, 2014

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-01740 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CLEAR CREEK 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 RIDGE RUNNER 8-19 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 MARION ENERGY, INC.

9. API NUMBER:
 43015306820000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 2150 South Central Expressway , McKinney, TX, 75070 972 540-2967  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 CLEAR CREEK 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1513 FSL 1735 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 20 Township: 14.0S Range: 07.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 EMERY 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

7 /15 /2014

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Ridge Runner 8-19 Casing set through Ferron. Waiting on completion
of Ferron.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Ben Evans 214 592-8615

TITLE
 Landman

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 7 /15 /2014

July 17, 2014

Sundry Number: 53389 API Well Number: 43015306820000Sundry Number: 53389 API Well Number: 43015306820000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING U-01740

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CLEARCREEK

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well RIDGE RUNNER 8-19

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
MARION ENERGY, INC. 43015306820000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
2150 South Central Expressway , McKinney, TX, 75070 972 540-2967 Ext CLEARCREEK

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: EMERY

1513 FSL 1735 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESW Section: 20 Township: 14.0S Range: 07.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

7/15/2014
WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Ridge Runner 8-19 Casing set through Ferron. Waiting on completion Accepted by the
of Ferron. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FORiftWCOMONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Ben Evans 214 592-8615 Landman

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 7/15/2014

RECEIVED: Jul. 15,

Sundry Number: 53389 API Well Number: 43015306820000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING U-01740

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CLEARCREEK

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well RIDGE RUNNER 8-19

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
MARION ENERGY, INC. 43015306820000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
2150 South Central Expressway , McKinney, TX, 75070 972 540-2967 Ext CLEARCREEK

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: EMERY

1513 FSL 1735 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESW Section: 20 Township: 14.0S Range: 07.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

7/15/2014
WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Ridge Runner 8-19 Casing set through Ferron. Waiting on completion Accepted by the
of Ferron. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FORiftWCOMONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Ben Evans 214 592-8615 Landman

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 7/15/2014

RECEIVED: Jul. 15,

Sundry Number: 53389 API Well Number: 43015306820000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING U-01740

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CLEARCREEK

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well RIDGE RUNNER 8-19

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
MARION ENERGY, INC. 43015306820000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
2150 South Central Expressway , McKinney, TX, 75070 972 540-2967 Ext CLEARCREEK

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: EMERY

1513 FSL 1735 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESW Section: 20 Township: 14.0S Range: 07.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

7/15/2014
WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Ridge Runner 8-19 Casing set through Ferron. Waiting on completion Accepted by the
of Ferron. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FORiftWCOMONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Ben Evans 214 592-8615 Landman

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 7/15/2014

RECEIVED: Jul. 15,



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining 

Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only 

Effective Date: 6/1/2015 
FORMER OPERA TOR: NEW OPERATOR: 
Marion Energy, Inc Vtah Gas Operating Solutsion, LLC 
1415 N Loop West, Suite 1250 1415 N Loop West, Suite 1250 
Houston, TX 77008 Houston, TX 77008 
281-540-0028 281-540-0028 

CA Number(s): Unit(s): Clear Creek 

WELL INFORMATION: 
Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Entity Mineral 
See Attache Listq 

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION: 
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 9345770-0161 

REVIEW: 

Surface 

6/24/2015 
6/24/2015 

1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: N/A 
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: N/A 
3. Reports current for ProductionlDisposition & Sundries: 
4. OPS/SIITA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 

6/25/2015 
6/25/2015 

5. VIC5 on all disposaVinjection/storage well(s) approved on: 7/8/2015 
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: Clear Creek Tank Battery 
7. Inspections ofPA statelfee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): 

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION: 
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 
3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): 

DATA ENTRY: 
1. Well(s) update in the OGIS on: 
2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on: 
3. Vnit(s) operator number update in OGIS on: 
4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on: 
5. StatelFee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on: 

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION: 

SU46335 
N/A 
SU46334 and SU46341 

7/9/2015 
7/9/2015 
7/912015 
N/A 
7/9/2015 
7/9/2015 

6/25/2015 

Type 

1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division 
of their responsibility to notifY all interest owners of this change on: 7/9/2015 
COMMENTS: 

Status 

7/9/2015 

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 6/1/2015
FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERATOR:
Marion Energy, Inc Utah Gas Operating Solutsion, LLC
1415 N Loop West, Suite 1250 1415 N Loop West, Suite 1250
Houston, TX 77008 Houston, TX 77008
281-540-0028 281-540-0028

CA Number(s): Unit(s): Clear Creek

WELL INFORMATION:
Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status
See Attache Listq

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION:
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/24/2015
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/24/2015
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 9345770-0161

REVIEW:
1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: N/A
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: N/A
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/25/2015
4. OPS/SI/TA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 6/25/2015
5. UIC5 on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: 7/8/2015
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: Clear Creek Tank Battery
7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): 6/25/2015

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: SU46335
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A
3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): SU46334 and SU46341

DATA ENTRY:
1. Well(s) update in the OGIS on: 7/9/2015
2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on: 7/9/2015
3. Unit(s) operator number update in OGIS on: 7/9/2015
4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on: N/A
5. State/Fee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 7/9/2015
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on: 7/9/2015

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 7/9/2015
COMMENTS:

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 6/1/2015
FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERATOR:
Marion Energy, Inc Utah Gas Operating Solutsion, LLC
1415 N Loop West, Suite 1250 1415 N Loop West, Suite 1250
Houston, TX 77008 Houston, TX 77008
281-540-0028 281-540-0028

CA Number(s): Unit(s): Clear Creek

WELL INFORMATION:
Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status
See Attache Listq

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION:
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/24/2015
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/24/2015
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 9345770-0161

REVIEW:
1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: N/A
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: N/A
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/25/2015
4. OPS/SI/TA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 6/25/2015
5. UIC5 on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: 7/8/2015
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: Clear Creek Tank Battery
7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): 6/25/2015

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: SU46335
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A
3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): SU46334 and SU46341

DATA ENTRY:
1. Well(s) update in the OGIS on: 7/9/2015
2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on: 7/9/2015
3. Unit(s) operator number update in OGIS on: 7/9/2015
4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on: N/A
5. State/Fee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 7/9/2015
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on: 7/9/2015

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 7/9/2015
COMMENTS:



Marion Energy, Inc to 
Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC 
Effective 611/2015 
Well Name Sec'TWN 

--I------

ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 3-17 17 130S 
RIDGE RUNNER 8-19 20 140S 

------- r-----
RIDGE RUNNER 2-18 17 140S 
UTAH FUEL 10 5 140S 
RIDGE RUNNER 13-17 17 140S 
UTAH FUEL I 5 140S 
UTAH FUEL 2 32 130S 
UTAH FUEL 3 32 130S 
UTAH FUEL 4 30 130S 
UTAH FUEL 5 31 130S 
UTAH MINERAL STATE 29 130S 
BALLPARKCYN 17-2 16 130S 
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-4 16 130S 
BALLPARK CYN 16-2 16 130S 
CORDINGL Y CYN 10-1 15 130S 
BALLPARK CYN 16-2X 16 1130S 
UTAH FUEL A-I 6 140S 
UTAH FUEL 8 19 130S 
OMAN 2-20 20 130S 
KENILWORTH RR#1 16 130S 
KENILWORTH RR #2 16 130S 
BALLPARK CANYON #1 16 130S 
CORDINGLY CYN 15-2 15 130S 
CORDINGLY CYN 15-1 15 130S 
CORDINGLYCYN 11-1 11 130S 
CORDINGLY CYN 15-5 15 130S 
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-3 16 130S 
ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 6-17 17 130S 
OMAN 10-29 29 130S 
KENILWORTH RR I-A 16 130S 
RIDGE RUNNER 11-20 20 140S 
RIDGE RUNNER 1-30 20 140S 
RIDGE RUNNER 2-19 117 1 140S 
RIDGE RUNNER 11-17 17 140S 

RNG 
070E 
070E 
070E 
070E 
070E 
070E 
070E 
070E 
070E 
070E 
070E 
100E 
100E 
100E 
100E 
100E 
070E 
070E 
070E 
100E 
100E 
100E 
100E 
100E 
100E 
100E 
100E 
070E 
070E 
100E 
070E 
070E 
070E 
070E 

API ! Entity Mineral Surface Type Status Unit 
4300731182 2550 State Fee WD A CLEAR CREEK 
4301530682 2550 Federal Federal GW lOPS CLEAR CREEK 
4301530683 16130 'Federal Federal GW OPS CLEAR CREEK 
4300716016 2550 Fee Fee GW P CLEAR CREEK 
4301530269 '2550 Federal Federal 

- 1---------

GW P CLEAR CREEK 
4300716009 12550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK 
4300716010 12550 I Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK 
4300716011 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK 
4300716012 2550 1 Fee Fee GW iPA CLEAR CREEK 
4300716013 2550 iFee 'Fee !GW PA CLEAR CREEK 
4300730102 ,2550 I State Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK 
4300731169 ; 15494 Fee Fee D PA 
4300731170 15495 Federal Fee D PA 
4300731171 15434 I Fee Fee D PA 
4300731173 15435iFee Fee D PA 
4300731207 115496 1 Fee Fee D PA -

4301516021 2550 iFee Fee iGW PA CLEAR CREEK 
4300716015 12550 !Fee Fee 'GW S CLEAR CREEK 
4300730289 12550 State Fee GW S CLEAR CREEK 
4300731006 114624 Fee Fee GW S 
4300731007 14625 !Fee Fee GW S 
4300731015 15159 Fee Fee GW S ---

4300731064 i 15160 State Fee IGW S 
4300731065 i15161 State Fee GW S 
4300731070 115432 ,Fee Fee GW S 
4300731167 15433 State Fee GW S 
4300731168 ,16041 Federal Fee GW S 
4300731181 2550 ,State Fee GW S CLEAR CREEK 
4300731210 12550 :State Fee IGW S CLEAR CREEK 
4300731229 116456: Fee Fee GW S 
4301530271 12550 I Federal Federal GW S CLEAR CREEK 
4301530680 2550 Federal Federal GW S CLEAR CREEK 
4301530684 2550 Federal Federal GW IS CLEAR CREEK 
4301530685 12550 _Federal Federal !GW S CLEAR CREEK 

1 6/25/2015 

Marion Energy,Irx:to
Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC
Effective 6/1/2015
Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status Unit
ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 3-17 17 130S 070E 4300731182 2550 State Fee WD A CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 8-19 20 140S 070E 4301530682 2550 Federal Federal GW OPS CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 2-18 17 140S 070E 4301530683 16130 Federal Federal GW OPS CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 10 5 140S 070E 4300716016 2550 Fee Fee GW P CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 13-17 17 140S 070E 4301530269 2550 Federal Federal GW P CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 1 5 140S 070E 4300716009 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 2 32 130S 070E 4300716010 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 3 32 130S 070E 4300716011 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 4 30 130S 070E 4300716012 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 5 31 130S 070E 4300716013 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAH MINERAL STATE 29 130S 070E 4300730102 2550 State Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
BALLPARKC304 17-2 16 130S 100E 4300731169 15494 Fee Fee D PA
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-4 16 130S 100E 4300731170 15495 Federal Fee D PA
BALLPARK CYN 16-2 16 130S 100E 4300731171 15434 Fee Fee D PA
CORDINGLY CYN 10-1 15 130S 100E 4300731173 15435 Fee Fee D PA
BALLPARK CYN 16-2X 16 130S 100E 4300731207 15496 Fee Fee D PA
UTAH FUEL A-1 6 140S 070E 4301516021 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAHFUEL8 19 130S 070E 4300716015 2550 Fee Fee GNV S CLEAltCIDEEK
OMAN 2-20 20 130S 070E 4300730289 2550 State Fee GW S CLEAR CREEK
KENILWORTH RR #1 16 130S 100E 4300731006 14624 Fee Fee GW S
KENILWORTH RR #2 16 130S 100E 4300731007 14625 Fee Fee GW S
BALLPARK CANYON #1 16 130S 100E 4300731015 15159 Fee Fee GW S
CORDINGLY CYN 15-2 15 130S 100E 4300731064 15160 State Fee GW S
CORDINGLY CYN 15-1 15 130S 100E 4300731065 15161 State Fee GW S
CORDINGLY CYN 11-1 ll 130S 100E 4300731070 15432 Fee Fee GW S
CORDINGLY CYN 15-5 15 130S 100E 4300731167 15433 State Fee GW S
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-3 16 130S 100E 4300731168 16041 Federal Fee GW S
ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 6-17 17 130S 070E 4300731181 2550 State Fee GW S CLEAR CREEK
OMAN 10-29 29 130S 070E 4300731210 2550 State Fee GW S CLEAR CREEK
KENILWORTH RR 1-A 16 130S 100E 4300731229 16456 Fee Fee GW S
RIDGE RUNNER 11-20 20 140S 070E 4301530271 2550 Federal Federal GW S CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 1-30 20 140S 070E 4301530680 2550 Federal Federal GW S CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 2-19 17 140S 070E 4301530684 2550 Federal Federal GW S CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 11-17 17 140S 070E 4301530685 2550 Federal Federal GW S CLEAR CREEK

1

Marion Energy,Irx:to
Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC
Effective 6/1/2015
Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status Unit
ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 3-17 17 130S 070E 4300731182 2550 State Fee WD A CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 8-19 20 140S 070E 4301530682 2550 Federal Federal GW OPS CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 2-18 17 140S 070E 4301530683 16130 Federal Federal GW OPS CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 10 5 140S 070E 4300716016 2550 Fee Fee GW P CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 13-17 17 140S 070E 4301530269 2550 Federal Federal GW P CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 1 5 140S 070E 4300716009 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 2 32 130S 070E 4300716010 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 3 32 130S 070E 4300716011 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 4 30 130S 070E 4300716012 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 5 31 130S 070E 4300716013 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAH MINERAL STATE 29 130S 070E 4300730102 2550 State Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
BALLPARKC304 17-2 16 130S 100E 4300731169 15494 Fee Fee D PA
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-4 16 130S 100E 4300731170 15495 Federal Fee D PA
BALLPARK CYN 16-2 16 130S 100E 4300731171 15434 Fee Fee D PA
CORDINGLY CYN 10-1 15 130S 100E 4300731173 15435 Fee Fee D PA
BALLPARK CYN 16-2X 16 130S 100E 4300731207 15496 Fee Fee D PA
UTAH FUEL A-1 6 140S 070E 4301516021 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAHFUEL8 19 130S 070E 4300716015 2550 Fee Fee GNV S CLEAltCIDEEK
OMAN 2-20 20 130S 070E 4300730289 2550 State Fee GW S CLEAR CREEK
KENILWORTH RR #1 16 130S 100E 4300731006 14624 Fee Fee GW S
KENILWORTH RR #2 16 130S 100E 4300731007 14625 Fee Fee GW S
BALLPARK CANYON #1 16 130S 100E 4300731015 15159 Fee Fee GW S
CORDINGLY CYN 15-2 15 130S 100E 4300731064 15160 State Fee GW S
CORDINGLY CYN 15-1 15 130S 100E 4300731065 15161 State Fee GW S
CORDINGLY CYN 11-1 ll 130S 100E 4300731070 15432 Fee Fee GW S
CORDINGLY CYN 15-5 15 130S 100E 4300731167 15433 State Fee GW S
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-3 16 130S 100E 4300731168 16041 Federal Fee GW S
ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 6-17 17 130S 070E 4300731181 2550 State Fee GW S CLEAR CREEK
OMAN 10-29 29 130S 070E 4300731210 2550 State Fee GW S CLEAR CREEK
KENILWORTH RR 1-A 16 130S 100E 4300731229 16456 Fee Fee GW S
RIDGE RUNNER 11-20 20 140S 070E 4301530271 2550 Federal Federal GW S CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 1-30 20 140S 070E 4301530680 2550 Federal Federal GW S CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 2-19 17 140S 070E 4301530684 2550 Federal Federal GW S CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 11-17 17 140S 070E 4301530685 2550 Federal Federal GW S CLEAR CREEK

1



FORM 9 STATE OF UTAH 
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER: 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantty deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to 
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. 

1. TYPE OF WELL 
OIL WELL D GAS WELL D OTHER Compressor 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 

Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC 

STATE TX ZIP 77008 I PHONE NUMBER: 

(281) 540-0028 
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: 

1415 North Loop West, STE en-v Houston 

4. LOCATION OF WELL 

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 

OTR/OTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNW 33 13S 7E 

ML-1257 
6. IF INDIAN. ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME: 

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME: 

Clear Creek 
8. WELL NAME and NUMBER: 

9. API NUMBER: 

10. FIELD AND POOL. OR WILDCAT: 

COUNTY: Carbon 

STATE: 

UTAH 

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION 

~ D ACIDIZE D DEEPEN D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION 
NOTICE OF INTENT 

(Submij in Duplicate) D ALTER CASING D FRACTURE TREAT D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL 

Approximate date work will start: D CASING REPAIR D NEW CONSTRUCTION D TEMPORARILY ABANOON 

6/1/2015 D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS III OPERATOR CHANGE D TUBING REPAIR 

D CHANGE TUBING D PLUG AND ABANDON D VENT OR FLARE 

D SUBSEQUENT REPORT D CHANGE WELL NAME D PLUG BACK D WATER DISPOSAL 
(Submit Original Form Only) 

D D D CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT·OFF 
Date of work completion: 

D D D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER: 

D CONVERT WELL TYPE D RECOMPLETE· DIFFERENT FORMATION 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc. 

Please accept this as notice that as of June 1st,2015, Marion Energy, Inc, is resigning as the operator of the "Clear Creek 
Compressor Station" and assigning Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC. as the successor of operator. This is in conjunction 
with Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC bond number S U 41P334 . 
"Clear Creek Compressor Station" 
Sec 33 13S 7E NWNW 

Date: let (( \ (~ 
Title: vi 

Signature: W~~~~~~'--tP~L.M~-- Date: (, r , ,. lA , or 
Name: PATlZ« .. t..J. ~b..n4.rr Title: kc.f\J'r''' It ... D'J) ~~ (~+.A.C'f' 

NAME (PLEASE It=~-+~~""M_a,--,,<-=--,.,----"-Ikc...:..:::. :::--ll......::J4'(::.=oou.... __ _ 

SIGNATURE--"HLJ!U""_"""'~:""IC!!!=-...JMIIICIo .. 1:=-.... .Mi~:..:II""_"IIIII;i/ _________ _ 
TITLE ,.....~.....".~N=T'=--.. _~=,=eI\\.=..:....1i1>.a.>I..IIOL...Am~ .. EJAL1.lAkr1:=-:~"'I:.-J--=-t:Ac..r 

~ - 'i".~, C DATE 

(This space for State use only) 

APPRO'VED 
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) 

JUL 09 2015 
. ~ OIL GAS & MINING _ 

BY; ~o en Q Q t<\rl t...t\O... 

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-1257

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME
SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° Clear Creekdrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Compressor 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1415 North Loop West, STE y Houston STATE TX ZIP77008 (281) 540-0028

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: COUNTY: Carbon

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:NWNW 33 13S 7E STATE:

UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICEOF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

6/1/2015 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please accept this as notice that as of June 1st,2015, Marion Energy, Inc. is resigning as the operator of the "Clear Creek
Compressor Station" and assigning Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC.as the successor of operator. This is in conjunction
with Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLCbond number du dr3W .

"Clear Creek Compressor Station"
Sec 33 13S 7E NWNW

Marion Ener

Signat e: Date:

Name: UA, Title:

S

ganha

u e:

r tion LLC

Date: i Nt

NAME(PLEASE INT) TITLE A& 4

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

JULO9 2015
OlL GAS &

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-1257

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME
SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° Clear Creekdrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Compressor 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1415 North Loop West, STE y Houston STATE TX ZIP77008 (281) 540-0028

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: COUNTY: Carbon

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:NWNW 33 13S 7E STATE:

UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICEOF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

6/1/2015 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please accept this as notice that as of June 1st,2015, Marion Energy, Inc. is resigning as the operator of the "Clear Creek
Compressor Station" and assigning Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC.as the successor of operator. This is in conjunction
with Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLCbond number du dr3W .

"Clear Creek Compressor Station"
Sec 33 13S 7E NWNW

Marion Ener

Signat e: Date:

Name: UA, Title:

S

ganha

u e:

r tion LLC

Date: i Nt

NAME(PLEASE INT) TITLE A& 4

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

JULO9 2015
OlL GAS &



FORM 9 STATE OF UTAH 
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER: 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new weUs, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to 
drill horizonlallaterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. 

1. TYPE OF WELL 
OIL WELL D GAS WELL III OTHER ______________________ ___ 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 

Marion Energy, Inc 

STATE TX ZIP 77008 
I PHONE NUMBER: 

I (281) 540-0028 
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: 

1415 N Loop W. STE 1250 CITY Houston 

4. LOCATION OF WELL 

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 

OTRIOTR. SECTION. TOWNSHIP. RANGE. MERIDIAN: 

ML-1257 
6. IF INDIAN. ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME: 

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME: 

Clear Creek Unit 
8. WELL NAME and NUMBER: 

9. API NUMBER: 

10. FIELD AND POOL. OR WILDCAT: 

Helper Field 

COUNTY: 

STATE: 

UTAH 

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION 

12l D ACIDIZE D DEEPEN D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION 
NOTICE OF INTENT 

(Submit in Duplicate) D AlTER CASING D FRACTURE TREAT D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL 

Approximate date work will start: D CASING REPAIR D NEW CONSTRUCTION D TEMPORARILY ABANDON 

6/1/2015 D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS III OPERATOR CHANGE D TUBING REPAIR 

D CHANGE TUBING D PLUG AND ABANDON D VENT OR FLARE 

D SUBSEQUENT REPORT D CHANGE WELL NAME D PlUG BACK D WATER DISPOSAL 
(Submit Original Fonn Only) 

D D D CHANGE WELL STATUS PROOUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF 
Date of work completion: 

D D D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS REClAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER: 

D CONVERT WELL TYPE D RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates. depths. volumes. etc. 

As of June 1 st, 2015, Marion Energy, Inc. resigns as Operator over its former Clear Creek Unit and Helper Field assets. In 
conjunction with this reSignation, Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC. will be taking over as the Successor Operator upon your 
approval. Please refer to all documents submitted by Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC. as successor unit operator and on 
behalf of Marion Energy, Inc_ regarding this change. 

Please see the attached Appendix A below for a complete well and facility list that will be transferred upon governing approval. 
As the Vice President of Marion Energy, Inc. I ask that you accept this letter as Marion Energy's official resignation and request 
to transfer operating rights to Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC_ 

S;9
naP9-

Doug FI nery 
Vice President 

~'~~t-T ~~rr 
SIGNATURE w~ 

(This space for State use only) 

Date: Co /,, /I:j 

TITLE 

DATE 

APPROVED 
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) JUL 09 2015 

DIV. OIL GAS & MINING 

BY: @ncb, 51 Q rt\JdJ..C\9.. 

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-1257

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to Clear Creek Unitdrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:

1415 N Loop W, STE 1250 an Houston TX ZIP77008 (281) 540-0028 Helper Field
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES ATSURFACE: COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

UTAH

ii. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICEOF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING O FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

6/1/2015 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGEWELL STATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

As of June ist, 2015, Marion Energy, Inc. resigns as Operator over its former Clear Creek Unitand Helper Field assets. In
conjunction with this resignation, Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC.will be taking over as the Successor Operator upon your
approval. Please refer to all documents submitted by Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC.as successor unit operator and on
behalf of Marion Energy, Inc. regarding this change.

Please see the attached Appendix A below for a complete well and facility list that will be transferred upon governing approval.
As the Vice President of Marion Energy, Inc. I ask that you accept this letter as Marion Energy's officialresignation and request
to transfer operating rights to Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC.

Signat e: Date:

Doug FI nery
Vice President

NAME(PLEASE INT) TITLE

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

D1V.OlL GAS &

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-1257

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to Clear Creek Unitdrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:

1415 N Loop W, STE 1250 an Houston TX ZIP77008 (281) 540-0028 Helper Field
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES ATSURFACE: COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

UTAH

ii. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICEOF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING O FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

6/1/2015 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGEWELL STATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

As of June ist, 2015, Marion Energy, Inc. resigns as Operator over its former Clear Creek Unitand Helper Field assets. In
conjunction with this resignation, Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC.will be taking over as the Successor Operator upon your
approval. Please refer to all documents submitted by Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC.as successor unit operator and on
behalf of Marion Energy, Inc. regarding this change.

Please see the attached Appendix A below for a complete well and facility list that will be transferred upon governing approval.
As the Vice President of Marion Energy, Inc. I ask that you accept this letter as Marion Energy's officialresignation and request
to transfer operating rights to Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC.

Signat e: Date:

Doug FI nery
Vice President

NAME(PLEASE INT) TITLE

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

D1V.OlL GAS &



APPENDIX A 

Well List 

Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Status 
ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 3-17 17 130S 070E 4300731182 A 
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 9-1 16 130S 100E 4300731172 LA 
JACOB 5-5 5 140S 070E 4300731190 LA 
JACOB 4-8 5 140S 070E 4300731191 LA 
OMAN 2-31 30 130S 070E 4300731246 LA 
OMAN 3-32 29 130S 070E 4300731247 LA 
MADSEN 11-20 19 130S 070E 4300731297 LA 
OMAN 7-19 19 130S 070E 4300731298 LA 
WOOLSEY 3-31 31 130S 070E 4300731305 LA 
OLD RAIL ROAD GRADE 17-1 17 130S 100E 4300731354 LA 
KENILWORTH WASH 18-1 18 130S 100E 4300731355 LA 
ALRAD CYN 13-1 13 130S 100E 4300731357 LA 
CORDINGLY CYN 15-6 15 130S 100E 4300731416 LA 
RIDGE RUNNER 7-20 20 140S 070E 4301530681 LA 
RIDGE RUNNER 8-19 20 140S 070E 4301530682 OPS 
RIDGE RUNNER 2-18 17 140S 070E 4301530683 OPS 
UTAH FUEL 10 5 140S 070E 4300716016 P 
RIDGE RUNNER 13-17 17 140S 070E 4301530269 P 
UTAH FUEL 1 5 140S 070E 4300716009 PA 
UTAH FUEL 2 32 130S 070E 4300716010 PA 
UTAH FUEL 3 32 130S 070E 4300716011 PA 
UTAH FUEL 4 30 130S 070E 4300716012 PA 
UTAH FUEL 5 31 130S 070E 4300716013 PA 
UTAH MINERAL STATE 29 130S 070E 4300730102 PA 
BALLPARK CYN 17-2 16 130S 100E 4300731169 PA 
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-4 16 130S 100E 4300731170 PA 
BALLPARK CYN 16-2 16 130S 100E 4300731171 PA 
CORDINGLY CYN 10-1 15 130S 100E 4300731173 PA 
BALLPARK CYN 16-2X 16 130S 100E 4300731207 PA 
UTAH FUEL A-l 6 140S 070E 4301516021 PA 
OMAN 14-20 29 130S 070E 4300731209 RET 
CORDINGLY CYN 2-1 2 130S 100E 4300731236 RET 
SWDl 28 130S 100E 4300731417 RET 
SHIMMIN 33-1 33 120S 110E 4300731431 RET 
SEAMONS 5-8 8 130S 070E 4300731432 RET 
CRITCHLOW 29-1 29 120S 110E 4300731433 RET 
RADAKOVICH 12-5-1 5 130S 070E 4300731434 RET 
ALLRED 10-1 10 120S 110E 4300731435 RET 

APPENDIXA

\VellList

Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Status
ALPINESCHOOLDIST3-17 17 130S 070E 4300731182 A
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 9-1 16 130S 100E 4300731172 LA
JACOB5-5 5 140S 070E 4300731190 LA
JACOB4-8 5 140S 070E 4300731191 LA
OMAN2-31 30 130S 070E 4300731246 LA
OMAN3-32 29 130S 070E 4300731247 LA
MADSEN11-20 19 130S 070E 4300731297 LA
OMAN7-19 19 130S 070E 4300731298 LA
VVOOLSEY3-31 31 130S 070E 4300731305 LA
OLDRAILROADGFukDE17-1 17 130S 100E 4300731354 LA
KENILVVORTHMULiH18-1 18 130S 100E 4300731355 LA
ALFULDCYN13-1 13 130S 100E 4300731357 LA
CORDINGLYCYN15-6 15 130S 100E 4300731416 LA
RIDGERUNNER7-20 20 140S 070E 4301530681 LA
RIDGERUNNER8-19 20 140S 070E 4301530682 OPS
RIDGERUNNER2-18 17 140S 070E 4301530683 OPS
UTAHFUEL10 5 140S 070E 4300716016 P
RIDGERUNNER13-17 17 140S 070E 4301530269 P
UTAHFUEL1 5 140S 070E 4300716009 PA
UTAHFUEL2 32 130S 070E 4300716010 PA
UTAHFUEL3 32 130S 070E 4300716011 PA
UTAHFUEL4 30 130S 070E 4300716012 PA
UTAHFUEL5 31 130S 070E 4300716013 PA
UTAH MINERAL STATE 29 130S 070E 4300730102 PA
BALLPARKCYN17-2 16 130S 100E 4300731169 PA
KENILM/ORTHRAILROAD15--‡ 16 130S 100E 4300731170 PA
BALLPARKCYN16-2 16 130S 100E 4300731171 PA
CORDINGLYCYN10-1 15 130S 100E 4300731173 PA
BALLPARKCYN16-2X 16 130S 100E 4300731207 PA
UTAHFUELA-1 6 140S 070E 4301516021 PA
OMAN14-20 29 130S 070E 4300731209 RET
CORDINGLYCYN2-1 2 130S 100E 4300731236 RET
SVVD1 28 130S 100E 4300731417 RET
SHIMMIN33-1 33 120S 110E 4300731431 RET
SEAMONS5-8 8 130S 070E 4300731432 RET
CRITCHLOVV29-1 29 120S 110E 4300731433 RET
RADAKOVICH12-5-1 5 130S 070E 4300731434 RET
ALLRED10-1 10 120S 110E 4300731435

APPENDIXA

\VellList

Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Status
ALPINESCHOOLDIST3-17 17 130S 070E 4300731182 A
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 9-1 16 130S 100E 4300731172 LA
JACOB5-5 5 140S 070E 4300731190 LA
JACOB4-8 5 140S 070E 4300731191 LA
OMAN2-31 30 130S 070E 4300731246 LA
OMAN3-32 29 130S 070E 4300731247 LA
MADSEN11-20 19 130S 070E 4300731297 LA
OMAN7-19 19 130S 070E 4300731298 LA
VVOOLSEY3-31 31 130S 070E 4300731305 LA
OLDRAILROADGFukDE17-1 17 130S 100E 4300731354 LA
KENILVVORTHMULiH18-1 18 130S 100E 4300731355 LA
ALFULDCYN13-1 13 130S 100E 4300731357 LA
CORDINGLYCYN15-6 15 130S 100E 4300731416 LA
RIDGERUNNER7-20 20 140S 070E 4301530681 LA
RIDGERUNNER8-19 20 140S 070E 4301530682 OPS
RIDGERUNNER2-18 17 140S 070E 4301530683 OPS
UTAHFUEL10 5 140S 070E 4300716016 P
RIDGERUNNER13-17 17 140S 070E 4301530269 P
UTAHFUEL1 5 140S 070E 4300716009 PA
UTAHFUEL2 32 130S 070E 4300716010 PA
UTAHFUEL3 32 130S 070E 4300716011 PA
UTAHFUEL4 30 130S 070E 4300716012 PA
UTAHFUEL5 31 130S 070E 4300716013 PA
UTAH MINERAL STATE 29 130S 070E 4300730102 PA
BALLPARKCYN17-2 16 130S 100E 4300731169 PA
KENILM/ORTHRAILROAD15--‡ 16 130S 100E 4300731170 PA
BALLPARKCYN16-2 16 130S 100E 4300731171 PA
CORDINGLYCYN10-1 15 130S 100E 4300731173 PA
BALLPARKCYN16-2X 16 130S 100E 4300731207 PA
UTAHFUELA-1 6 140S 070E 4301516021 PA
OMAN14-20 29 130S 070E 4300731209 RET
CORDINGLYCYN2-1 2 130S 100E 4300731236 RET
SVVD1 28 130S 100E 4300731417 RET
SHIMMIN33-1 33 120S 110E 4300731431 RET
SEAMONS5-8 8 130S 070E 4300731432 RET
CRITCHLOVV29-1 29 120S 110E 4300731433 RET
RADAKOVICH12-5-1 5 130S 070E 4300731434 RET
ALLRED10-1 10 120S 110E 4300731435



RADAKOVICH 12-5 5 130S 070E 4300731436 RET 
SEAMONS 5-8-2 8 130S 070E 4300731437 RET 
WOOLSEY 3-31-1 31 130S 070E 4300731438 RET 
ALLRED 13-1 13 120S 110E 4300731439 RET 
JACOB 5-5 5 140S 070E 4300731513 RET 
UTAH FUEL 8 19 130S 070E 4300716015 S 
OMAN 2-20 20 130S 070E 4300730289 S 
KENILWORTH RR #1 16 130S 100E 4300731006 S 
KENILWORTH RR #2 16 130S lOOE 4300731007 S 
BALLPARK CANYON #1 16 130S 100E 4300731015 S 
CORDINGLY CYN 15-2 15 130S 100E 4300731064 S 
CORDINGLY CYN 15-1 15 130S 100E 4300731065 S 
CORDINGLY CYN 11-1 11 130S 100E 4300731070 S 
CORDINGLY CYN 15-5 15 130S 100E 4300731167 S 
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-3 16 130S 100E 4300731168 S 
ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 6-17 17 130S 070E 4300731181 S 
OMAN 10-29 29 130S 070E 4300731210 S 
KENILWORTH RR I-A 16 130S 100E 4300731229 S 
RIDGE RUNNER 11-20 20 140S 070E 4301530271 S 
RIDGE RUNNER 1-30 20 140S 070E 4301530680 S 
RIDGE RUNNER 2-19 17 140S 070E 4301530684 S 
RIDGE RUNNER 11-17 17 140S 070E 4301530685 S 

Facility List 

Clear Creek Compressor Station 33 13S 7E 

RADAKOVICH12-5 5 130S 070E 4300731436 RET
SEAMONS5-8-2 8 130S 070E 4300731437 RET
VVOOLSEY3-31-1 31 130S 070E 4300731438 RET
ALLRED13-1 13 120S 110E 4300731439 RET
JACOB5-5 5 140S 070E 4300731513 RET
UTAHFUEL8 19 130S 070E 4300716015 S
OMAN2-20 20 130S 070E 4300730289 S
KENILVVORTHRR#1 16 130S 100E 4300731006 S
KENILVVORTHRR#2 16 130S 100E 4300731007 S
BALLPARKCANYON#1 16 130S 100E 4300731015 S
CORDINGLYCYN15-2 15 130S 100E 4300731064 S
CORDINGLYCYN15-1 15 130S 100E 4300731065 S
CORDINGLYCYN11-1 11 130S 100E 4300731070 S
CORDINGLYCYN15-5 15 130S 100E 4300731167 S
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-3 16 130S 100E 4300731168 S
ALPINESCHOOLDIST6-17 17 130S 070E 4300731181 S
OMAN10-29 29 130S 070E 4300731210 S
KENILVVORTHRR1-A 16 130S 100E 4300731229 S
REDGERUNNER11-20 20 140S 070E 4301530271 S
RIDGERUNNER1-30 20 140S 070E 4301530680 S
RIDGERUNNER2-19 17 140S 070E 4301530684 S
RI]DGERUNNER11-17 17 140S 070E 4301530685 S

Facility List

Clear Creek Compressor Station 33 13S

RADAKOVICH12-5 5 130S 070E 4300731436 RET
SEAMONS5-8-2 8 130S 070E 4300731437 RET
VVOOLSEY3-31-1 31 130S 070E 4300731438 RET
ALLRED13-1 13 120S 110E 4300731439 RET
JACOB5-5 5 140S 070E 4300731513 RET
UTAHFUEL8 19 130S 070E 4300716015 S
OMAN2-20 20 130S 070E 4300730289 S
KENILVVORTHRR#1 16 130S 100E 4300731006 S
KENILVVORTHRR#2 16 130S 100E 4300731007 S
BALLPARKCANYON#1 16 130S 100E 4300731015 S
CORDINGLYCYN15-2 15 130S 100E 4300731064 S
CORDINGLYCYN15-1 15 130S 100E 4300731065 S
CORDINGLYCYN11-1 11 130S 100E 4300731070 S
CORDINGLYCYN15-5 15 130S 100E 4300731167 S
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-3 16 130S 100E 4300731168 S
ALPINESCHOOLDIST6-17 17 130S 070E 4300731181 S
OMAN10-29 29 130S 070E 4300731210 S
KENILVVORTHRR1-A 16 130S 100E 4300731229 S
REDGERUNNER11-20 20 140S 070E 4301530271 S
RIDGERUNNER1-30 20 140S 070E 4301530680 S
RIDGERUNNER2-19 17 140S 070E 4301530684 S
RI]DGERUNNER11-17 17 140S 070E 4301530685 S

Facility List

Clear Creek Compressor Station 33 13S



RECEIVED: Sep. 21, 2016

                           FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-01740 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CLEAR CREEK 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 RIDGE RUNNER 8-19 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 UTAH GAS OPERATING SOLUTIONS,LLC

9. API NUMBER:
 43015306820000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1415 North Loop West, STE 1250 , Houston, TX, 77008 281 540-0028  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 CLEAR CREEK 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1513 FSL 1735 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 20 Township: 14.0S Range: 07.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 EMERY 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

10 /1 /2016

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Please see attached the procedure to plug and abandon the
well

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Patrick Merritt 281 540-0028

TITLE
 President

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 9 /21 /2016

September 29, 2016

Sundry Number: 74568 API Well Number: 43015306820000Sundry Number: 74568 API Well Number: 43015306820000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING U-01740

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CLEARCREEK

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well RIDGE RUNNER 8-19

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
UTAHGAS OPERATING SOLUTIONS,LLC 43015306820000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1415 North Loop West, STE 1250 , Houston, TX, 77008 281 540-0028 Ext CLEARCREEK

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: EMERY

1513 FSL 1735 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESW Section: 20 Township: 14.0S Range: 07.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

10/1/2016
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENTREPORT DEEPEN FRACTURETREAT NEWCONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached the procedure to plug and abandon the Approved by the
well Utah Division of

OFI, Gas and Mining

September 29, 2016

PleaseReviewAttachedCuditiusofAppron\

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Patrick Merritt 281 540-0028 President

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 9/21/2016

RECEIVED: Sep. 21,



RECEIVED: Sep. 29, 2016

  

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43015306820000

Plug # 1 should be set as close to perfs @ 6329' as possible. 

Plug #2 should be placed above liner top from ~1900' to 1700' to isolate perfs.. 

No CBL on file to confirm TOC. 

Prior to RIH with CICR, establish circulation through perfs @ 540'. 

Sundry Number: 74568 API Well Number: 43015306820000Sundry Number: 74568 API Well Number: 43015306820000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
'

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices
OTI. BAS Pr N1NTNG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43015306820000

Plug # 1 should be set as close to perfs @ 6329' as possible.

Plug #2 should be placed above liner top from ~1900' to 1700' to isolate perfs..

No CBL on file to confirm TOC.

Prior to RIH with CICR, establish circulation through perfs @ 540'.

RECEIVED: Sep. 29,



RECEIVED: Sep. 21, 2016

RIDGE RUNNER 8-19 Plugging Procedure 
 
 
Well Name: RIDGE RUNNER 8-19 
API Number: 43-015-30682 

Location: NESW Sec.20-T14S-R7E Emery County, Utah 
Conductor Csg: 20” set @ 40’ 
Surface Csg: 13 3/8” K-55 54.5# set @ 540’ 
Intermediate. Csg: 9 5/8” J-55 36# set @ 3891’ 
Prod. Csg: 7”N-80 23# @7,024' 
PBTD: 7040’ 
 
1. MIRU well service rig. NDWH and NUBOP 

 

2. Determine if there are rods in the hole and release the rods and POH with the rods  

 

3. Determine if there are tubings in the hole and Release and POH with tubings 
 
4. TIH w/ wireline set 7” CIBP. Set plug @ +/-5100’. TIH w/ 2 7/8” tbg and tag plug. 

 

5. Pump cement through 2 7/8” tbg setting a 100’ plug from +/-5100– 5000 (approx. 20sx) 

 

6. TOH w/tbg and TIH w/7” CIBP set at +/- 1800’ 

 

7. Pump cement through 2 7/8” tbg setting a 100’ plug from +/-1800’ – 1700’ (approx. 20sx) 

 

8. RU perforators and perforate @ +/-540’. Set a wireline set CICR at +/-525’. Sting into retainer and establish 

circulation down the 7” csg and back up into the 7” X 9 5/8” & 9 5/8” X 13 3/8” annuli. If circulation cannot 

be established through perfs sting out of retainer and set a 525’ plug (approx.108sx) to surface in the 7” 

csg. If circulation can be established, pump 84sx cement in the 7 ”X 9 5/8” annulus to the surface and 

180sx cement in the 9 5/8”X13 3/8” annulus, and sting out of retainer and set a 525’ plug (approx.108 sx) 

to surface in the 7” csg on top of the retainer. 

 

9. All cement should be Type II or Class G or equivalent cement mixed at 5.2 to 5 gal/sk to make a slurry 

weight of 15.8 ppg.  

 

10. Erect dry hole marker on top of the plug extending 4 feet above the ground with following description:  

OPERATOR: UTAH GAS OPERATING SOLUTIONS,LLC 

WELL NAME & NUMBER: RIDGE RUNNER 8-19 

API NUMBER: 43-015-30682 

LOCATION: NESW SEC.20-T14S-R7E EMERY COUNTY, UTAH 

Sundry Number: 74568 API Well Number: 43015306820000Sundry Number: 74568 API Well Number: 43015306820000

RIDGE RUNNER 8-19 Plugging Procedure

Well Name: RIDGE RUNNER 8-19

API Number: 43-015-30682

Location: NESW Sec.20-T14S-R7E Emery County, Utah
conductorCsg: 20" set @40'
Surface Csg: 13 3/8" K-55 54.5# set @540'
Intermediate. Csg: 9 5/8" J-55 36# set @3891'
Prod. Csg: 7"N-80 23# @7,024'
PBTD: 7040'

1. MIRU well service rig. NDWH and NUBOP

2. Determine if there are rods in the hole and release the rods and POH with the rods

3. Determine if there are tubings in the hole and Release and POH with tubings

4. TlH w/ wireline set 7" CIBP. Set plug @ +/-5100'. TlH w/ 2 7/8" tbg and tag plug.

5. Pump cement through 2 7/8" tbg setting a 100' plug from +/-5100-5000 (approx. 20sx)

6. TOH w/tbg and TlH w/7" CIBP set at +/- 1800'

7. Pump cement through 2 7/8" tbg setting a 100' plug from +/-1800' -1700' (approx. 20sx)

8. RU perforators and perforate @ +/-540'. Set a wireline set CICR at +/-525'. Sting into retainer and establish

circulation down the 7" csg and back up into the 7" X 9 5/8" & 9 5/8" X 13 3/8" annuli. If circulation cannot

be established through perfs sting out of retainer and set a 525' plug (approx.108sx) to surface in the 7"

csg. If circulation can be established, pump 84sx cement in the 7 "X 9 5/8" annulus to the surface and

180sx cement in the 9 5/8"X13 3/8" annulus, and sting out of retainer and set a 525' plug (approx.108 sx)

to surface in the 7" csg on top of the retainer.

9. All cement should be Type II or Class G or equivalent cement mixed at 5.2 to 5 gal/sk to make a slurry

weight of 15.8 ppg.

10. Erect dry hole marker on top of the plug extending 4 feet above the ground with following description:
OPERATOR: UTAH GAS OPERATING SOLUTIONS,LLC

WELL NAME & NUMBER: RIDGE RUNNER 8-19

API NUMBER: 43-015-30682

LOCATION: NESW SEC.20-T14S-R7E EMERY COUNTY, UTAH

RECEIVED: Sep. 21,



RECEIVED: Sep. 21, 2016

11. In case the area is agricultural or cultivated, there is no need for marker and only cut off the casing 3’ 

below the ground level and cap it with above description welded on the cap. 

Sundry Number: 74568 API Well Number: 43015306820000Sundry Number: 74568 API Well Number: 43015306820000

11. In case the area is agricultural or cultivated, there is no need for marker and only cut off the casing 3'

below the ground level and cap it with above description welded on the cap.

RECEIVED: Sep. 21,



RECEIVED: Sep. 21, 2016

Present Completion

     API: 43-015-30682

     GL: 9,814' LOCATION:

     KB: Clear Creek

SW SE NE  Sec 19 (BHL)

SW NE SW (surface)

Casing Strings: Sec. 20 T14S R7E

Emery County, UT

20" Conductor @ 40'

      TOC @ surface

Work Suspended on last report 1/10/08

13-3/8", 54.5# , J-55 @ 540'

      Cmtd w/ 540 sx

      TOC @ surface 

9-5/8" @ 3,891'

      Cmtd w/ 940 sx

      TOC @ unknown, did not circ

7", J-55 @ 7,024' Emery (10/07)

      Cmtd w/ 720 sx 1,788'-96', 1,840'-50' (4 spf)

      TOC @ unknown, did not circ

Drilling Notes: Sqz holes @ 2000' (10/07)

Directional Well: SQZ w/ 100 sx

  KOP @ 1,080' +/-, Azim=266 deg Drill out

  build 2 deg/100' to 49 deg @ 5,105' +/-,

  decreasing to 41deg @ 7,040' +/-,

  Azim=295 deg

Drill w/ water and air, 

Tight spots and lost circulation

No DST's or Cores taken

Possible Fish @ 5,120' +/- ?

Ferron  (10/07)

6,329'-34', 68'-88', 6,446'-60' (4 spf)

Sqz holes @ 6,850' (10/07)

Spud Date:  8/13/07 Sqz w/ 510 sx

TD Date: 9/8/07

Comp Date: TD = 7,040' MD, 5,839' TVD

Ridge Runner #8-19 

Sundry Number: 74568 API Well Number: 43015306820000Sundry Number: 74568 API Well Number: 43015306820000

Present Completion '

API: 43-015-30682 Ridge Runner #8-19
GL: 9,814' ' LOCATION:
KB: Clear Creek

SW SE NE Sec 19 (BHL)
SW NE SW (surface)

Casing Strings: Sec. 20 Tl4S R7E
Emery County, UT

20" Conductor @40'
TOC @surface

Work Suspended on last report 1/10/08
13-3/8", 54.5# ,

J-55 @ 540'
Cmtd w/ 540 sx
TOC @surface

9-5/8" @3,891'
Cmtd w/ 940 sx
TOC @unknown, did not circ

7", J-55 @ 7,024' Emery (10/07)
Cmtd w/ 720 sx 1,788'-96', 1,840'-50' (4 spf)
TOC @unknown, did not circ ·

·

Drilling Notes: Sqz holes @ 2000' (10/07)
Directional Well: SQZ w/ 100 sx

KOP@l,080'+/-,Azim=266deg ·:·: ·:·: Drillout
build 2 deg/100' to 49 deg @5,105' +/-,

decreasing to 41deg @7,040' +/-,
Azim=295 deg

Drill w/ water and air,
Tight spots and lost circulation

No DST's or Cores taken ::·
.: .:

·

..

Possible Fish @5,120' +/- ?

I ·

Ferron (10/07)
6,329'-34', 68'-88', 6,446'-60' (4 spf)

Sqz holes @ 6,850' (10/07)
Spud Date: 8/13/07 Sqz w/ 510 sx
TD Date: 9/8/07
Comp Date: TD = 7,(40' MD, 5,E35' TVD

RECEIVED: Sep. 21,
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