MID-
POWER

RESOURCE CORPORATION

April 17, 2006

Utah Division of Oil Gas and Mining
ATTN: Diana Whitney

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah

84116

RE: Ridge Runner #11-18, #2-18, #11-17, #8-19, #1-30, #7-20
Mid-Power Resource Corp. Application for Permit to Drill
Clear Creek Unit 13S-7E and 14S-7E, Carbon and Emery Counties, Utah

Dear Ms. Whitney

Please find enclosed two copies of the above referenced well APD’s that is to be
drilled in Clear Creek Unit located in 13S-7E and 14S-7E, Carbon and Emery
Counties, Utah.

If you require any further information, please do not hesitate to contact me at
(972) 540-2967 ext. 3004 or email bevans@marionenergy.com

Sincerely,
g5 e———

Benjamin Evans

Landman

Marion Energy Inc.

(Agent for Mid-Power Resource Corp.)

RECEYED
APR 1 8 2006

DIV, OF Uil GAS & MINING

8290 West Sahara Avenue, Suite 186, Las Vegas, Nevada, 89117
Telephone: (702) 838-0716, Fax: (702) 838-5087



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 3

AMENDED REPORT []
(highlight changes)

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

5. MINERAL LEASE NO: 6. SURFACE:
USA-U-02353 Federal

DRILLE] REENTER [] DEEPEN []

oL [ cas

1A. TYPE OF WORK:

B. TYPE OF WELL: OTHER SINGLE ZONE [Z] MULTIPLE ZONE |:|

7. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

8. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Clear Creek Unit

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
Mid-Power Resource Corporation

9. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

Ridge Runner # 1-30

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER:

10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

8290 W. Sahara, # 186 ., Las Vegas grare NV, 89117 (702) 838-0716 mu{
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) 48 ;;(p Yq )( 4 ??2{}9 l%f 3 q 5902[‘ 7 - ‘ (- l ‘p{,'}' g 11@;’;/&;!; SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,
aTsurrace: 1719.25 FWL 1502.88ft FSL /SW  Section 20 148-7E §ecosty H2 21 yil \/ NESW ' 20 14S 7E
AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZoNE: 246t FEL 7071t FNL/I;{? Section 30 14S-7E 34.5241770
4 - 1136k Y
14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:
Approx 5 miles south of Clear Creek Emery UTAH
15. DISTANCE TO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE (FEET) 16. NUMBER OF ACRES IN LEASE: 17. NUMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:
Surface 1719.25ft Bottom Hole 7071t 2375.28 40
18. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING, COMPLETED, OR 18. PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:
APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET)
Surface 20ft Bottom Hole 2950ft 6,050 | See Attached Bond Document
21. ELEVATIONS (SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATE DATE WORK WILL START: 23. ESTIMATED DURATION:
9,815 GR 7/1/2006 30 days
24. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY, YIELD, AND SLURRY WEIGHT
14 3/4 10 3/4 J-55 40.5 500 | Premium "G" 420 sks  1.25 cuft/sk 14.2 ppg
97/8 7 5/8 J-55 264 3,450 | Lead: Prem. Lite 320 sks 3.82 cuft/sk 11 ppg
Tail: 50/50 Poz 755 sks  1.25 cuft/sk 14.2 ppg
77/8 5112 J-55 17 7,250 | Lead: Prem. Lite 496 sks  3.82 cuft/sk 11 ppg
Tail: 50/50 Poz 275 sks 1.25 cuft/sk 14.2 ppg
25. ATTACHMENTS

VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES:

m WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER m COMPLETE DRILLING PLAN

D EVIDENCE OF DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER

D FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANY OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

VP Land

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Keri Clarl;é TITLE

AN A
< %/B \ DATE

SIGNATURE

e e 51 4

(This space for State use only)

API NUMBER ASSIGNED: 45”0‘ §-30¢, ,S:D
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r
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11/2001
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® Drill Hole Location NOTES:

‘e’ Metal Cap (Found)

O Brass Cap (Searched for, but not found)

Calculated Corner

( oo
[ GPS Measured |

1. UTM and Latitude (;/P

are derived usin% cLI)

Longitude Coordinates
S Pathfinder and are

shown in NAD 2 atum.
P
SURFACE TARGET
IILAT / LONG LAT / LONG
39°35'03.011"N 59°35'L0.2L0"N
[11°10'25.491"W [11°10'32.04L1"W

Location:
The well location was determined using a Trimble 5700
GPS survey grade unit.

Basis of Bearing:
The Basis of Bearing is GPS Measured.

GLO Bea,r‘i,;ndq:
The Bearings indicated are per the recorded plat obtained
from the U.S. Land Office.

Basis of Elevation: K .

Bosis of Elevation of 10452° being at the Southeast Section
Corner of Section 7, Township 14 South, Range 7 East,

Salt Lake Base and Meridian, as shown on the Candlond Mountain
Quadrangle 7.5 minute series map.

Degcr‘i.ﬁt'ion of Location:

u ion

Proposed Drill Hole located in the NE/4 SW/4 of Section 20,
T14S, R7E, S.L.B.&M., being 1502.88" North and 1719.25" East
from the Southwest Section Corner of Section 20, T14S, R7E,
Salt Lake Base & Meridian.

Jarget Locgtion

Proposed Target located in the NE/4 NE/4 of Section 30,
T14S, R7E, S.L.B.&M., being 707.00° South and 246.00° West
from the Northeast Section Corner of Section 30, T14S, R7E,
Salt Lake Base & Meridian.

Surveyor's Certificate:

I, Albert J. Spensko, a Registered Professional Land Surveyor,
holding Certificate 146652 State of Utah, do hereby certify that
the information on this drawing is a true and accurate survey

based on data of record and was conducted under my personal
direction and supervision as shown hereon.

TALON RESOURCES, INC.

195 North 100 West P.0. Box 1230
Huntizgton, Utsh 84528
Phone (435)687-8310  Fax (435)687-5311
E-Mail talonectv.net

l@%Marion Energy Inc.

Ridge Runner #1-30
Sections 20&30, T14S, R7E, S.L.B.&M.
Emery County, Utah

Orawn By: Checked By:
N. BUTKOVICH LWJ./AJS.
Drawing No. Dote:
0 %0 1000 A-1 Sede:
( IN FEET ) 1" = 1000’
1 inch = 1000 ft. et 1 o 4 ?3505
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POWER

RESOURCE CORPORATION

April 17, 2006

Diana Whitney

State of Utah

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
P.O. Box 145801

Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Re: Directional Drilling R649-3-11

Ridge Runner #1-30: 1502.88 ft FSL, 1719.25ft FWL / SW S20 14S-7E (Surface)
707 ft FNL, 246ft FEL / NE S30 14S-7E (bottom hole)
Emery County, UT

Dear Ms. Whitney

Pursuant to the filing of Mid-Power Resource Corporation’s Application for Permit to Drill the above
referenced well on January 5™ 2006, we are hereby submitting this letter in accordance with Oil and Gas
Conservation Rule R649-3-11 pertaining to the exception to location and Siting of wells.

. The Ridge Runner #1-30 well is located within the Clear Creek Federal Unit Area.

. Mid-Power Resource Corporation is permitting this well as a directional well in order to maximize
drainage of the reservoir in a topographically challenging area.

. The concept of drilling Multiple directional wells from a single pad site will allow Mid-Power
Resource Corporation to minimize surface disturbance that would be otherwise cause by two or
more separate pad sites. Mid-Power Resource Corporation plans to Drill 3 directional wells from
this pad site.

) Mid-Power Resource Corporation hereby certifies that it is the sole working interest owner within
460 feet of the entire directional well bore.

Therefore, based upon the above information Mid-Power Resource Corporation requests the permit be
granted pursuant to R649-3-11.

Sincerely,

) e e
fr% - 7 RN s S
53 OJ, >
Benjamin Evans

Landman

Marion Energy Inc.

(Agent for Mid-Power Resource Corp.)

8290 West Sahara Avenue, Suite 186, Las Vegas, Nevada, 89117
Telephone: (702) 838-0716, Fax: (702) 838-5087



Aid-Power Resource Corporation
Drilling Plan
Page DP-I-

Drilling Plan
Mid-Power Resource Corporation
Ridge Runner 1-30
1. Geologic Surface Formation
a. Quaternary
2. Estimated Tops
Name TVD 1D Production Phase
Top of Emery 1875ft 1849ft Gas
Top of Blue Gate 3100ft 34131t Gas
Top of Ferron 53191t 6350ft Gas
™D 6019ft 7276ft

3. Casing Program

a. See Form #3 Section 24.

4. Operators Specifications for Pressure Control Equipment

a. 2000 psi WP Double Gate BOP or Single Gate BOP (Schematic Attached).

b. Functional test daily.

c. All casing strings shall be pressure tested (0.2psi/foot or 1500 psi, whichever is greater)
prior to drilling the plug after cementing; test pressure shall not exceed the internal yield
pressure of the casing.

d. All ram-type preventers and related control equipment shall be tested at the rated
working pressure of the stack assembly or at 70 percent of the minimum internal yield
pressure of the casing, whichever is less. Tests shall be done at the time of installation,
prior to drilling out, and weekly. All testes shall be for a period of 15 minutes.

5. Auxiliary Equipment

a. Kelly Cock - Yes

b. Float at the bit - No

c. Monitoring Equipment on the mud system - visually

d. Full opening safety valve on rig floor - Yes

e. Rotating head - Yes

f  The blooie line shall be at least 6 inches in diameter and extend at least 100 feet from the
well bore into the reserve/blooie pit.



fid-Power Resource Corporation
Drilling Plan
Page DP-2-

g Blooie line ignition shall be provided by a continuous pilot (ignited when drilling below
500 feet).

h. Compressor shall be tied directly to the blooie line through a manifold.

i, A mistor with a continuous stream of water shall be installed near the end of the blooie
lines for dust suppression.

6. Proposed Circulating Medium

Depth Mud Type
0 to TD Air/ Mist
7. Testing, Logging, and Coring Program
a. Cores- Possible core of Ferron Sand
b. DST - None anticipated
c. Logging - DIL-GR (TD to base of sutface casing).
a. FDC-CNL-GR-Cal (TD to base of surface casing).
d. Formation and Completion Interval: ~ Ferron interval, final determination of
completion will be made by analysis of logs.
Simulation: Simulation will be designed for the particular area of interest as
encountered.
e. Frac gradient: Approximately 0.80 psi/ft.

8. Anticipated Cementing Program:
a. See Form #3, Section 24.

Final cement volumes to be calculated from caliper log with an attempt to be made to circulate cement to
the surface. A bond log will b e run across the zone of interest and across zones as required by the
authorized officer to insure protection of natural resources.

9. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential Hazards:

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No H,S has been encountered in or known to
exist from previous wells drilled to similar depths in the general area. Maximum anticipated bottom hole
pressure equals approximately 1500 psi (calculated 0.517 psi/ft) and maximum anticipated surface
pressure equals approximately 862 psi (bottom hole pressure minus the pressure of a partially evacuated
hole calculated at 0.22 psi/ft).
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Surface Use Plan
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Surface Use Plan

Mid-Power Resource Corporation
Ridge Runner 1-30

Existing Road:

Topo Map ‘A’ is the vicinity map showing the access route from Scofield, Utah.

Topo Map ‘B’ shows the proposed access road to each well. It also shows existing roads
in the immediate area.

The existing and proposed access road, unless otherwise stated, shall be crowned,
ditched, and dipped from the nearest improved road.

Occasional maintenance blading and storm repairs will keep roads in good condition.
There shall be no mud blading on the access road. Vehicles may be towed through the
mud provided they stay on the roadway.

Planned Access Roads:

o

o

W@ o

Maximum grade will be 8% or less.

No turnouts are required.

Low water crossings to be placed in the proposed access road during drilling process and
culverts may be installed at a later date.

Road surface material will be that native to the area.

No cattleguards are required.

The proposed access road was flagged at the time the location was staked.

The back slopes of the proposed access road will be no steeper than vertical or ¥ :1 in
rock and 2:1 elsewhere.

Location of Existing Wells:

a.

See Topo Map ‘B’

Location of Existing and/or Proposed Facilities:

a.

b.

All Petroleum Production Facilities are to be contained within the proposed location
sites.
In the event that production of these wells is established, the following will be shown:
i. Proposed location and attendant lines, by flagging, if off well pad.

ii. Dimensions of facilities.

iii. Construction methods and materials.
The area used to contain the proposed production facilities will be built using native
materials. If these materials are not acceptable, then other arrangements will be made to
acquire them from private sources. These facilities will be constructed using bulldozers,
graders, and workman crews to construct and place the proposed faculties.
All permanent facilities placed on the locations shall be painted a non-reflective color,
which will blend with the natural environment.
A dike shall be constructed around the tank battery, of sufficient capacity to adequately
contain at least 110 percent of the storage capacity of the largest tank within the dike.
All buried pipelines shall be covered to a depth of 3 feet except at road crossings where
they shall be covered to a depth of 4 feet.



vlid-Power Resource Corporation

Surface Use Plan
Page SU-2-
g. Construction width of the right-of-way/pipeline route shall be restricted to 50 feet of
disturbance.
h. Pipeline location warning signs shall be installed within 90 days upon completion of
construction.

Location and Water Supply:

a.  Any water to be used for the drilling of this well will be from the Price River Water
Improvement District (an adjudicated industrial water source) and transported by a
local trucking company (Nielson Construction).

b. No water wells are to be drilled.

Source of Construction Materials:

a. No construction materials are needed for drilling operations. In the event of production,
the small amount of gravel needed for facilities will be hauled in by truck form a local
gravel pit over existing access roads from the area. No special access other than for
drilling operations and pipeline construction is needed.

b.  All access roads crossing BLM land is shown on Topo Map ‘B’.

c. All well pad surface disturbance areas are on fee lands.

Methods for Handling Waste Disposal:

Drill cuttings will be buried in the reserve pit when covered.

Drilling fluids will be contained in the reserve pit.

¢.  Any hydrocarbon liquids produced while production testing will be contained in a test
tank. Any unavoidable spills of oil or other adverse substances or materials will be
removed immediately during drilling progress or during completion operations.

d. Portable chemical toilets will be provided and services by a local commercial sanitary
service.

e. Garbage and trash will be collected in a trash cage and its contents hauled to a sanitary
landfill. All wastes caused by the construction activities shall be promptly removed and
disposed of in a sanitary landfill or as directed by the company representative.

f. Prior to commencement of drilling, the reserve pit will be fenced on three sides using 39-
inch net wire with at least one (1) strand of barbed wire. All wire is to be stretched
before attaching to corner posts. When drilling activities are completed it will be fenced
on the fourth side and allowed to dry (if liquids are present). After drying, the fences
will be removed and the pits shall be buried. Reclamation will be undertaken no later
than the fall of the year after all drilling activity has ceased.

o

Ancillary Facilities:

a. No airstrips, camps, or other living facilities will be built off the locations. Housing and
office trailers will be on the location as seen on the location layout.

Well Site Layout:

a. Seeattached cut sheet.
b. Company representatives will determine if the pit is to be lined, and if so, the type of
material to be used.



10.

1.

d.

e.
£

vid-Power Resource Corporation
Surface Use Plan
Page SU-3-

Topsoil shall be stripped to a depth of 4 to 6 inches and stockpiled as shown on the
location layout plat.

The back slopes of the locations will be no steeper than vertical or ¥ :1 in rock and 2:1
elsewhere.

The upper edges of all cut banks on the access roads and well pads will be rounded.
Catchment ponds to be placed as required to intercept drainage re-routes.

Plans for Restoration:

jmalN e’

Immediately upon completion, the location and surrounding area will be cleared of all
debris, materials, trash and junk not required for production.

Before any dirt work to restore the location takes place, the reserve pit must be
completely dry. The reserve pit will be reclaimed within one (1) year from the date of
well completion.

All disturbed areas will be seeded with the mixture, which is found suitable by the Utah
Division of Wildlife Resources and the landowner.

The seedbed will be prepared by disking, following the natural contour. Drill seed on
contour at a depth no greater than ¥ inch. In areas that cannot be drilled, the seed will
be broadcast at double the seeding rate and harrowed into soils. Certified seed is
recommended.

Fall seeding will be completed after September, and prior to prolonged ground frost.

If the well is a producer, access roads will be upgraded and maintained as necessary to
prevent soil erosion, and accommodate year round traffic. Areas unnecessary to
operations will be reshaped, topsoil distributed, and seed distributed according to the
above mixtures. Perennial vegetation would be established. Additional work may be
required in case of seeding failures, etc.

If the well is abandoned or is a dry hole, the access road and location will be restored to
approximate the original contours. During reclamation of the site, the fill material will
be pushed into cuts and up over the back slope. No depressions will be left that would
trap water or form ponds. Topsoil will be distributed evenly over the location and
seeded according to the above mixture. The access road and the location shall be ripped
or disked prior to seeding. Perennial vegetation must be established. Additional work
shall be required in case of seeding failures, etc.

Annual or noxious weeds shall be controlled on all disturbed areas. Method of control
shall be by an approved mechanical method or an Environmental Protection Agency
(EPA) registered herbicide. All herbicide application will be in cooperation with Carbon
County Weed Control personnel.

Other Information:

a.

b.

C.

Man uses the area for the primary purpose of grazing domestic livestock.
i. All activity shall cease when soils or road surfaces become saturated to a depth
of three inches, unless otherwise approved by the company representative.

ii. If any fossils are discovered during construction, the operator shall cease
construction immediately and notify the company representative so as to
determine the significance of the discovery.

A Class III cultural resource inventory was completed prior to disturbance by a qualified
professional archaeologist.

The operator is responsible for informing all persons in the area who are associated with
this project that they will be subject to prosecution for knowingly disturbing historic or
archaeological sites, or for collecting artifacts. If historic or archaeological materials are



12.

13.

Mid-Power Resource Corporation
Surface Use Plan
Page SU-4-

uncovered during construction, the operator is to immediately stop work that might
further disturb such materials and contact the State Historic Preservation Office
(SHPO). The SHPO Officer will outline (if any) what mitigation is appropriate.

i. If the operator wished, at any time, to relocate activities to avoid the expense of
mitigation and/or delays associate with this process, the SHPO will assume
responsibility for whatever recordation and stabilization of the exposed
materials may be required. Otherwise, the operator will be responsible for
mitigation costs. The SHPO will provide technical and procedural guidelines for
the conduct of mitigation. Upon verification from the State that the required
mitigation has been completed, the operator will be allowed to resume
construction.

d. Less than 10,000 pounds of any chemical(s) from the EPA’s Consolidated list of
Chemicals Subject to Reporting Under Title I of the Superfund Amendments and
Reauthorization Act (SARA) of 1986, and less then threshold planning quantity (TPQ) of
any extremely hazardous substance(s), as defined in 40 CFR, would be used, produced,
transported, stored, disposed, or associated with the proposed action.

Lessee’s or Operator’s Representative:

Marion Energy, Inc.
Mr. Keri Clarke
119 South Tennessee, Suite 200
McKinney, TX 75069
(972)540-2967

Certification:

I hereby certify that I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the proposed drill
site(s) and access route(s); that I am familiar with the conditions which presently exist; that the
statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and correct; and, that the
work associated with the operations proposed herein will be performed by Marion Energy, Inc.
and its contractors and subcontractors in conformity with the plan and the terms and conditions
under which it is approved.

This statement is subject to the provision of 18 U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

/) - -o

Keri Clarke Date
Company Representative
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Las Vegas, NV, 89117
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Mid-Power Resource Corp
Directional Well - Ridge Runner #1-30
SW Section 20 T. 14S., R 7E,S.L.B.
Surface Location: 1502 88' FSL, 1719.25' FWL
NE Section 30 T. 145, R. 7E., S.L B.
Target Location: 707" FNL, 246' FEL

Topographic Map

Created on April 14th 2006

Created by John Pinkerton Revised: MM-DD-YY
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Mid-Power Resource Corporation

‘ ~8é90 Waest éaharﬁ Auenﬁe. Suue 188
Lea Vegas, Nevada 88117
702-838-0716 Fan 702-838-5087

August 25, 2005

Mr. Keri Clarke

Vice President - Land

Marion Energy inc.

119 South Tennessee, Suite 200
-McKinney, Texag 75089

Re: Clear Creek Unit — Carbon/Emery Counties, Utah

Dear Mr. Clarke:

Mid-Power Resource Corporation, as operator of the Clear Creek Unit located in
Carbon/Emery Counties, Utah, hereby, authorizes and empowers Marion Energy
Inc. to act as a designated agent on its behalf.

As designated agent, Marion Energy inc. shall handie all operational matters
relating to the Clear Creek Unit and shall deal directly with all State and Federal
regulatory agencies in Utah (USDA Forest Service, BLM, and the DOGM) on
such operational matters.

This authorization is in accordance with the terms and conditions outlined in the
Farmout and Exploration Agreement entered into on February 22, 2005 by and
between Mid-Power Resource Comporation and Marion Energy Inc.

Sincerely, :
President

2-d I¥LE-bTI2-204 801440 2uiauncsoy dg1:21 S0 80O 22d



i

PERFORMANCE BOND
(See Mntrwstions on mwerse/

- —ry v

mm-d-du.l“ﬂ

n g .'-f'r."'"T’. v r— Futridciecsl, Sesruinky) swing n
Oivaptechey snd roviswiig the colinciion of isforvation, Setid Eomymints rganding tvs Lisdi eatirute o arvy oitas
S0t 0f this el of Serviashin, Inchating ecayeation fur Sutiuting Whin Susion, 1o W FAR Becrevedst INVIG, Pedud Acquizitien Pollcy Ohdvien, G8A, Wesnorm,
ot

'i%w;nu—q—:

Hid-Powar Resouxcs Corporation

3000 Huward-Hughvn-Porieray—860- $270 ). Sadace Ave | [dmacroua Y eremensesr
Lag Voglu._ﬂavadr{ -6%?.%.0'1.7 coite 8L e oo

“CORET VG Pimcit) and St nobwstos)
in Bsu of surety(ies) hereon, YWa the unde Bh:laﬂmdepoauv-p-\a!
mnumhbw)shmomds 1&"';!,%@”5@'*5'.j

casti. Said deposk i pisdged as BCUTHY for perienTranoe and fuliliment of the
** oonriract desigasted hareon.

o ol a jsienty sl seversty.  However,
n%wmmhmﬂusﬂmhmmmnw G
of pivindng a jebw or actiorw ageinot sy w ol

for the peymexet of the werm shewn eppesie the

of the panel eurn.
CONDSTIONS:
The Principat hew envad o Uis contact lasntied abovs.
THEREFOME:

The whove ebiigation is vold If tha Principsl -
(a1} and fuXills ol the itvg tu, inrre, cobdiions, snd agreements of the contrct during the 1 wtm ot the
m.sw"m"' " ..Nadmm,w‘wh&-h mormmwﬁMﬂmhﬁm .
Mhmwmmvm-mmdﬂma' am waved, o ;
&8 Pays o-thd Government the full mmount

of the texou iTEessd by the Gevernmwnt, W the seki cantniat ke subjosnt to the Miker Act, O US.C.
Z708-ZF08), whictt s colectud, seduntad, of withiwid from wadsd pald by the Princiost In 2avying sut the cotetrutton centract with rrepeet
which this bond Is tumighad, gy,
YATRESS: * » _,\\‘c‘"%o Rcé"'o,,'
The Principe! end Surstytiest 4 thid par borvd and aéthod Yrelr souis B 18 sbave deta. ST .C‘O %
. PAMGIPAL S5 TO(DUIBIA"-._'EO%__
ESF == 103
ead [l 2 Sl i3S
] A T M S e
=0 ] Lo, 201 97
wver {, 4:\ & “\¢
: TNDIVIDUAL gux: RZTRAANTT
BOMATURELS)
L] _fOeed
WA XY A
Togsedh
mm%
WANE & TCIARRGTY CWT
«| AoOrES : U .
E v ) 3 Corporato
s Suul
L 3 kB
M e ———y— S
A ro':mmucnw &‘gw.-Bu)
Approved byt BOND APPROVING OFFYXCER Date

2-d 1+LE-+#12-20L 301340 2uUI3zuUNOdDY eGgH+:D1 SO 21 2234



STATE OF UTAH FORM 4B
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

BondNo. 9578030406 DWISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
COLLATERAL BOND
KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS:
That we {operator name) _MId-Power Resource Corporation as Principal,
which ia duly suthorized and qualified to do business In the State of Utah, are held and fimly bound unto the Stlate of Utah in the sum of:
Ona Hundred Elghty Four Thousand One Hundred Eighty: dollars ($_$184,180.00

lawfl money of the Uniled States by virlue of the following financial instruments (cash acoount, negotable bonds of the Unlted Stales, a state
or municipality, of negotiable cerfificate of deposit — see Rule R648-3-1):

Negotlable Cerlificate of Deposit #9578030406

payable lo the Director of thie Division af Oft, Gas and Minlng, as agent of the State of Utah, for the use and benofit of the State of WKah for the
faithiul payment of which we bind ourselves, our heirs, executors, administrators and successors, jointly and severally by these presents.

THE CONDITION OF THIS OBLIGATION IS SUCH THAT, WHEREAS the Principal Is or will be engaged in the driling, redriiting, deepening,
repairing, operating, and plugging and abandonment of a well or wells and restoring the wel site or sites In the State of Utah for the purposes of
oll or gas production and/ar the Injection and disposal of flulds In connection therewith for the following described Iand or weil:

X Banket Dond Cﬁmﬂvequ‘:gflﬂmpﬂ,?:h?&ﬂ maFt;i\o M EDLALYP MiKe. Davt s>
individual Bond: Weil No:
Section:_________ Township: Range:
County: , Utah

NOW, THEREFORE, [f the above bounden Principal shali comply with all the provisions of the laws of the Siste of Uiah and Lhe rues, orders and
requirements of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining of the State of Utah, Inciuding, but not limited o the proper plugging and sbandonment of wells
and well slte restoration, then this obigation Is void; otherwlse, the same shall be and remaln In full force and effect.

IN TESTIMONY WHEREOF, said Princlpal has hereunto subsaibed lis name and has caused this instrument {o be signed by its duly authorized
officers and Hts corporate or notary seal o be affixed this

25 day of _March ,20 05

(Corporate or Notary Seal here)

See attached Jurat

Mid-Power Resource Corporation

[ Attestee: Dato:
Principal (company name)
By James W. Scott CEO & President
%ﬁue m
Signature

- COPY

194
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ALL-PURPOSE ACKNOWLEDGMENT

State of California

County of _S(ALAMONIO
Thaath 29,005 e Ayarts Hoplrsen)

T (NGTARY)

(DATE)

personally appeared L) GMBS CSGDH‘

Mpersonally known to me - OR - [7] proved to me on the basis of satisfactory
: evidence to be the person(s) whose name(s)
is/are subscribed to the within instrument and
acknowledged to me thar hefshe/they executed
the same in his/her/their authorized
capacity(ies). and that by lis/her/their
signatures(s) on the instrument the person(s),
or the cntity upon behall of which the
person(s) acted, executed the instrument.

SIGNER(S)

e

WITNESS my hand and otficial seal.

NOTARY'S SIGNATURE

OPTIONAL INFORMATION =em—m—m
The information below is not required by law. However, it could prevent fraudulenl attachmenl of this acknowl-
edgment to an unauthorized document.

CAPACITY CLAIMED BY SIGNER (PRINCIPAL)  DESCRIPTION OF ATTACHED DOCUMENT

WK pivipuaL
] CORPORATE OFFICER IQ‘!‘QM[ Dxi

TITLE OR TYPE OF DOCUMENT

- TOrLes St
(] PARTNER(S) .j—

(O] ATTORNEY-IN-FACT NUMBER OF PAGES
(] TRUSTEE(S)

{C] GUARDIAN/CONSERVATOR
(] OTHER:

DATE OF DOCUMENT

QTHER

SIGNER IS REPRESENTING: RIGHT THUMBPRINT
NAME OF PERSON(S) OR ENTITY(IES) OF

SIGNER

Top of thumbprinl Fere

APA 589 VALLEY-SIERRA. 800-367 3169

p-d I+LE-#12-20L 821440 2uraunoaoy eg¥:01 S0 21 290



[FAR

August 24, 2004

Mr. Ed Bonner

State of Utah

Schoo! and Institutional Trust
Lands Administration

675 East 500 South, Suite 500

Salt Lake City, Utah 84102-2818

Re:  Mid-Power Resource Corporation
Bonding Requirement Changes

Dear Ed:

In'response fo TLA’s bonding requirement changes, we have reviewed and verified that
our bonding requirements are in compliance with the new rules.

Qur findings indicate that a cash deposit in the amount of $20,000 was accepted by TLA
on September 11, 2002 as surety to cover operations of the Utah Mineral State Weil and
the Oman 2-20 Wall under lease ML1256. Those two wells are also covered under our
bond with DOGM for plugging and abandonment.

Since the new rules require operators to post a performance bond with TLA in the
amount of $5,000 per well, we request that the cash balance of $10,000 be release back
to Mid-Power Resource Corporation.

Please feel free to contact me should you have any questions conceming this matter. |
can be reached at 702-838-0716.

Sincerely,

Susan Trimboli

CC: Earlene Russell - DOGM — Fax Number 801-358-3840
Mark Roedell ~Mid-Power Service Corporation

T¥LE-+12-20L 321440 <durizunoooy gg¥:0I SO 21

oeq



School and Institutional
Utah! TRUST LANDS ADMINISTRATION

675 Zast 500 South, Sulle 5C0
i 2-2818
Olene S. Walker Sak Lake City, Utah 8410
Govornor 801%.538-5100
Kevin S. Carter 801-365-0922 (Fax)
Director hitp:/evares trustiands cam

May 4, 2004

MID-POWER RESOURCES CORPORATION
3753 HOWARD HUGES PARKWAY

SUITE 200

LAS VEGAS, NV 89109

R.E: Bonding Requirement Changes
Effeclive: February 24, 2004

Dear Sir or Madam:

Effective February 24, 2004, School and Institutional Trust Lands Administralion ("TLA") entered
into an agreement with the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (“DOGM") to transfer to DOGM the
responsibility of maintaining a sufficient performance bond to plug each dry or abandoned well,
repalr each well causing pollution, and mainfain and restore each well site, if necessary. In the
past, operalors have been required to post bonds in various amounts with TLA to cover their
operations on lands owned and adminisiered by TLA; with DOGM if the company had operations
on fee lands in Utah; and, still another, if ils operations were on federal lands. Under our new
agreement with DOGM, TLA will no longer require operators to post a plugging and reclamation
bond with this office. All plugging and reclamation bonds for operations on TLA lands or fee
lands will now be administered by DOGM under their rule R649-3-1, as revised July 1, 2003. if
you currently have a bond in place with DOGM, please check with their office as it may be
sufficient to cover operaltions on trust lands and no additional bond may be required. The DOGM
rules can be viewed and bond forms can be downloaded from the DOGM website at
http://ogm.utah.gov/oilgas.

Operators will be required, however, to post a performance bond in the amount of $5,000 per
well or $15,000 statewide with TLA to cover lease obligations on TLA lands not otherwise
covered by the DOGM bond. Delinquent or unpaid royalties would be examples of deficlencies
that could be remedied by the bond. The surety sources are the same as set outin TLA's
current rules at R850-20-2800.

Your company has 120 days from the date of this letter or until Seplember 1, 2004, to verify and
update your bonding lo come into compliance with the new rules. Should you need assistance or
have compliance questions, please contact the following people for help:

At TLA — Ed Bonner (801/538-5151 or edbonner@utah.gov)
At DOGM - Earlene Russell (801/538-5336 or earlenerussell@utah. gov)

As soon as TLA is provided evidence by your company that: (1} it has sufficient bonding with

DOGM to cover plugging and reclamation operations; (2) your company has no cutstanding
obligations with TLA that would be remedied by your bond, and, (3) your company provides TLA

: Ulah!

I D 0 WWhere sdons connieet 1
1
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——— — - —-withthe-apprepriale-we!l orstatewide replacement hond for future lease obligations _in the _

appropriate amount, your current bond will be released. If you would like your bond with TLA o
be transferred to DOGM's ownership, and if the Instrument allows for such a transfer, please
make arrangements with your surety and with DOGM. No bonds will be released by TLA until
sufficient evidence is provided that all required bonding is in place and that there are no
outstanding obligations to TLA.

There will be a lransition period, but TLA sees this as a positive move for the industry that will
simplify your statewide bonding requirements in the State of Utah.

We appreciate your assistance wiih these changes and look forward to hearing from you.
Yours very truly,

SCHOQL AND INSTITUTIONAL TRUST

Asslstant Director/Oil & Gas

1+LE-+12-20L 221340 Jurijunoooy eL+:01 SD 21 220
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WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 04/18/2006

WELL NAME: RIDGE RUNNER 1-30
OPERATOR : MID-POWER RESOURCE CORP ( N2215 )
CONTACT: KERI CLARKE
PROPOSED LOCATION:
NESW 20 140S 070E
SURFACE: 1502 FSL 1719 FWL
BOTTOM: 0707 FNL 0246 FEL S»C 30
COUNTY:  EMERY
LATITUDE: 39.59025  LONGITUDE: -111.1667
UTM SURF EASTINGS: 485684 NORTHINGS: 4382084
FIELD NAME: CLEAR CREEK ( 10 )
LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal
LEASE NUMBER: U-02353
SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal

API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-015-30680

PHONE NUMBER: 702-838-0716

INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
Tech Review Initials Date
Engineering

Geology

Surface

PROPOSED FORMATION: FRSD
COALBED METHANE WELL? NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED:

LOCATION AND SITING:

v~ Plat R649-2-3.
" Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Stal] Feel] nit: CLEAR CREEK
{(No. 9578030406 )
N Potash (Y/N) R649-3-2. General
M 0il sShale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting: 460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells
+~ Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception
(No. PRRV )
- Drilling Unit
RDCC Review (Y/N) Board Cause No:
Date: )
( ) Eff Date:
MP  pee surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:
MP Intent to Commingle (Y/N) «/ R649-3-11. Directional Drill
COMMENTS :
STIPULATIONS: )' 1:>LLA¢Z::)CmerUJN(\S

Z’\S?arr%f \ilsf
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Diana Whitney - Clear Creek.doc

Page 1

United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO:

3160
(UT-922)
April 25, 2006
Memorandum
To: Assistant Field Office Manager Resources,
Moab Field Office
From: Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer

Subject: 2006 Plan of Development Clear Creek Unit Carbon County,
Utah.

Pursuant to email between Diana Whitney, Division of Qil, Gas and Mining, and Mickey
Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land Management, the following wells are
planned for calendar year 2006 within the Clear Unit, Carbon County, Utah.

AP # WELL NAME LOCATION
(Proposed PZ Ferron)

43-015-30683 Ridge Runner 2-18 Sec 17 T14S RO7E 0338 FSL 0279 FWL
BHL Sec 18 T14S RO7E 0476 FNL 1524 FEL

43-015-30684 Ridge Runner 11-18 Sec 17 T14S RO7E 0292 FSL 0259 FWL
BHL Sec 18 T14S RO7E 0270 FSL 2471 FEL

43-015-30685 Ridge Runner 11-17 Sec 17 T14S RO7E 0315 FSL 0269 FWL
BHL Sec 17 T14S RO7E 2439 FSL 2470 FWL

43-015-30680 Ridge Runner 1-30 Sec 20 T14S RO7E 1502 FSL 1719 FWL
BHL Sec 30 T14S RO7E 0707 FNL 0246 FEL

43-015-30681 Ridge Runner 7-20 Sec 20 T14S RO7E 1524 FSL 1752 FWL
BHL Sec 20 T14S RO7E 1434 FNL 1454 FEL

43-015-30682 Ridge Runner 8-19 Sec 20 T14S RO7E 1513 FSL 1735 FWL
BHL Sec 19 T14S RO7E 2211 FNL 0747 FEL

This office has no objection to permitting the wells at this time.




JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.

Governor
=]
O’ GARY R. HERBERT
Ry I Lieutenant Governor
State of Utah

April 26, 2006
Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAEL R. STYLER
FExecutive Director

Mid-Power Resource Corporation

. Division 0.f ' 8290 West Sahara, #186
Oil, Gas & Mining Las Vegas, NV 89117
JOHN R. BAZA

Division Director
Re: Ridge Runner 1-30 Well, Surface Location 1503 FSL, 1719’ FWL, NE SW,

Sec. 20, T. 14 South, R. 7 East, Bottom Location 0707’ FNL, 0246’ FEL,
NE NE, Sec. 30, T. 14 South, R. 7 East, Emery County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-015-30680.

Sincerely,
Gil Hunt
Associate Director
mf
Enclosures
cc: Emery County Assessor

Bureau of Land Management, Moab District Office

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 » facsimile (801) 359-3940 « TTY (801) 538-7458 ¢ www.ogm.utah.gov



Operator: Mid-Power Resource Corporation

Well Name & Number Ridge Runner 1-30

API Number: 43-015-30680

Lease: USA-U-02353

Surface Location: NE SW Sec._ 20 T. 14 South R. 7 East
Bottom Location: NE NE Sec. 30 T. 14 South R. 7 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
. Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
. Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

(8]

. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

b

This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the “Board”).
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.

6. In accordance with Utah Admin. R.649-3-11, Directional Drilling, the operator shall submit a
complete angular deviation and directional survey report to the Division within 30 days
following completion of the well.



POWER

RESOURCE CORPORATION

May 5, 2006 L/?“ 6,;.3098@

Utah Division of Oil Gas and Mining
ATTN: Diana Whitney

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah

84116

RE: Ridge Runner #11-18, #2-18, #11-17, #8-19, #1-30, #7-20
Mid-Power Resource Corp. Amendment to Surface use and Drilling Plans
Clear Creek Unit 13S-7E and 14S-7E, Carbon and Emery Counties, Utah

Dear Ms. Whitney

Per Tom Lloyd’s (USDA Forest Service) request, please find enclosed copies of
the amended Surface Use Plans and Drilling Plans that pertain to the above
referenced wells that are to be drilled in the Clear Creek Unit located in 13S-7E
and 14S-7E, Carbon and Emery Counties, Utah.. I have also included a diagram
that depicts the well equipment layout of each pad site.

If you require any further information, please do not hesitate to contact me at
(972) 540-2967 ext. 3004 or email bevans@marionenergy.com

Sincerely,
/ —
BT o=

Benjamin Evans

Landman

Marion Energy Inc.

(Agent for Mid-Power Resource Corp.)

RECEIVED

“d -
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DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

8290 West Sahara Avenue, Suite 186, Las Vegas, Nevada, 89117
Telephone: (702) 838-0716, Fax: (702) 838-5087
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Surface Use Plan
Mid-Power Resource Corporation
Ridge Runner #1-30

Thirteen Point Surface Use Plan

1. Existing Roads

a.

The proposed well site is located approximately 15 miles south of Scofield,
Utah.

Directions to the location from Scofield, Utah are as follows:

From Scofield proceed south on Highway 96 for approximately 2.8 miles.
Turn west onto the Eccles Canyon Road (Highway 264) and proceed 4.1
miles. Turn left onto the Forest Service Road (#018) and proceed through a
gate and then in a southeasterly direction for approximately 8 miles. Tumn
right onto the new access road and continue 0.1 miles to the location.

For location of access roads see Maps A & B.
Top map A is the vicinity map showing the access route from Scofield, Utah.

Topo map B shows the proposed access road to each well. It also shows
existing roads in the immediate area

Improvement to the existing Forest Service Road will require upgrading as
specified by the Forest Service.

All existing roads will be maintained and kept in good repair during all
drilling and completion operations associated with this well.

Existing roads and newly constructed roads on surface under the jurisdiction
of any Surface Managing Agency shall be maintained in accordance with the
standards of the SMA.

Road use permit # 0410-03-13 which expires June 1*1 2006 is currently being
renewed/extended. Maintenance of the access road will be conducted
according to conditions outlines in the referenced road use permit.



2. Planned Access Roads

a.

The last 7.1 miles of access road will be upgraded to accommodate rig traffic.
The road will have a subgrade of 14 feet with a running surface of 12 feet.
Four inches of gravel will be placed on portions of the access road.

Surface disturbance and vehicular travel will be limited to the approved
location and approved access route. Any additional area needed will be
approved in advance.

3. Location of Existing Wells Within a 1-Mile Radius of the Proposed Location

a.

b.

c.

f.

Water wells — non

Injection wells — none

Producing wells — none

Drilling wells — none

Shut-in wells — Ridge Runner #11-20 & #13-17 (See Location Map L-1)

For reference please see topo map B

4. Location of Tank Batteries and Production Facilities

All permanent structures (onsite for six months or longer) constructed or
installed (including pump jacks) will be painted a neutral color to blend with
the surrounding environment. The proposed color for this site is Juniper
Green unless otherwise stipulated by the Forest Services. Facilities required
to comply with the Occupational Safety and Health Act (OSHA) will be
excluded.

If storage facilities/tank batteries are constructed on this lease, the
facility/battery or the wellpad shall be surrounded by a containment dike or
sufficient capacity to contain at a minimum, the entire content of the largest
tank within the facility/battery, unless more stringent protective requirements
are deemed necessary by the authorized officer.

All loading lines will be placed inside the berm surrounding the tank battery

Gas meter runs for each well will be located within 500 feet of the wellhead.
The gas flowline will be buried or anchored down from the wellhead to the
meter and 500 feet downstream of the meter run or any production facilities.
Meter runs will be housed and/or fenced. All buried pipelines shall be



covered to a depth of 3ft except at road crossings where they shall be covered
to a depth of 44t.

The oil and gas measurement facilities will be installed on the well location.
The oil and gas meters will be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries.
Tests for meter accuracy will be conducted monthly for the first three months
on new meter installations and at least quarterly thereafter. The AO will be
provided with a date and time for the initial meter calibration and all future
meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will be
submitted to the Vernal District Office. All meter measurement facilities will
conform with Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 4 for liquid hydrocarbons and
Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 5 for natural gas measurement.

A production facility diagram is attached showing placement of all proposed
production facilities. (See survey outline A-3)

Any necessary pits will be properly fenced to prevent any wildlife entry.

All site security guidelines identified in 43 CFR 3162.7 regulations will be
adhered to.

All access roads will be maintained as necessary to prevent erosion and
accommodate year-round traffic.

The road will be maintained in a safe useable condition.

The site will require periodic maintenance to ensure that drainages are kept
open and free of debris, ice, and snow, and that surfaces are properly treated
to reduce erosion, fugitive dust, and impacts to adjacent areas.

The area used to contain the proposed production facilities will be built using
native materials. If these materials are not acceptable, then other
arrangements will be made to acquire them from private sources. These
facilities will be constructed using bulldozers, graders, and workman crews to
construct and place the proposed facilities.

5. Location and Water Supply

a.

b.

Any water to be used for the drilling of this well will be from the Price River
Water Improvement District (an adjudicated industrial water source) and
transported by a local trucking company (Nielson Construction).

No water wells are to be drilled.

6. Source of Construction Material

a.

Surface and subsoil materials in the immediate area will be utilized.



b. No construction materials are needed for drilling operations. In the event of
production, the small amount of gravel needed for facilities will be hauled in
by truck from a local gravel pit over existing access roads in the area. No
special access other than for drilling operations and pipeline construction is
needed.

¢. The use of materials under BLM jurisdiction will conform with 43 CFR
3610.2.3. Construction material will not be located on lease.

d. No construction materials will be removed from Federal land.
e. All access roads crossing BLM land is shown on topo map B.

7. Methods of Handling Waste Disposal

a. The reserve pit will be constructed so as not to leak, break, or allow discharge.
The reserve pit will be lined with a minimum 10mil plastic liner.

b. The reserve pit will be constructed of sufficient size and capacity for the
necessary fluids for drilling and to contain any runoff from the drill site. Pits
will not be constructed within intermittent or perennial stream channels.

c. No trash, scrap pipe, etc., that could puncture the liner will be disposed of in
the pit. Garbage and trash will be collected in a trash cage and its contents
hauled to a sanitary landfill. All wastes caused by the construction activities
shall be promptly removed and disposed of in a sanitary landfill or as directed
by the company representative.

d. The reserve pit will be constructed in undisturbed material and below the
natural ground level.

e. A minimum 2-foot freeboard will be maintained in the pit at all times during
the drilling operation and the pit will be fenced during drilling and completion
operations.

f. Burning will not be allowed. All trash will be contained in a trash cage and its
contents removed at the end of drilling operations and hauled to an approved
disposal sight.

g. After first production, produced waste water will be confined to a unlined pit
or storage tank for a period not to exceed ninety (90) days. During the 90-day
period, in accordance with Onshore Order No. 7, an application for approval
of a permanent disposal method and location, along with the required water
analysis, will be submitted for the AO’s approval. Failure to file an



application within the time allowed will be considered an incident of
noncompliance.

h. Drill cuttings are to be contained and buried in the reserve pit.

i. Any salts and/or chemicals which are an integral part of the drilling system
will be disposed of in the same manner as the drilling fluid.

j.  Sewage will be placed in a portable chemical toilet or holding tank and
disposed of in accordance with state and county regulations.

k. The produced fluids (other than water) will be produced into a test tank until
such time as construction of production facilities is completed. Any spills of

oil, gas, salt water or other produced fluids will be cleaned up and removed.

8 .Ancillary Facilities

There are no airstrips, camps, or other facilities planned during the drilling of the
proposed well.

9. Well Site Layout

a. All cut and fill slopes will be such that stability can be maintained for the life
of the activity. The upper edges of all cut banks on the access roads and well
pads will be rounded. Cut and fill slopes will be constructed as follows:

Height of Slope Slope
0-5 feet 3:1
6-10 feet 2:1
Over 10 feet 1-1/2:1

b. All fills will be free from vegetative materials and will be compacted in lifts
no greater than 12 inches in thickness to a minimum of 90 percent Proctor dry
density sufficient to prevent excessive settlement.

c. The working surface of the drill site will be surfaced with crushed gravelto a
depth sufficient to support anticipated loads throughout the life of the well.
Usually a depth of 12 inches of gravel is anticipated.

d. A diversion ditch having the minimum dimensions of 3 feet horizontal to 1
foot vertical (3:1 ditch), will be constructed around the site to divert surface
waters from flowing onto the site. The ditch will be located at the base of the
cut slope and around the toe of the fill slopes (see Drawing No. 1-
Construction Requirements of Typical Well Sites). A straw dike will be
constructed in the ditch outflow to trap any sediment produced from the raw
slopes. A culvert will be necessary where the access road enters the site.



e. A berm will be constructed around the perimeter of the site to contain all
precipitation, spills, and other fluids from leaving the site. The berm will be a
minimum of 18 inches high, 12 inches wide at the top, and having 1-1/2:1 side
slopes. The site surface will be graded to drain to the reserve pit. The
drainage pattern to be constructed will be modified for each site, depending on
the site specific conditions.

f.  The reserve pit will be located on the east side of the location.

g. The stockpiled topsoil (first six inches or maximum available) will be stored
along the perimeter of the location as shown on the location platt.

h. See Location Layout for orientation of rig, cross section of drill pad and cuts
and fills. (See attached Platt A-4)

i. The location of mud tanks, reserve pit, trash cage, pipe racks, living facilities
and soil stockpiles will be shown on the Location Layout.

j.  All pits will be fenced to prevent wildlife entry.

k. The reserve pit fencing will be on three sides during drilling operations and on
the fourth side when the rig moves off the location. Pits will be fenced and
maintained until cleanup. Reclamation will be undertaken no later than the

fall of the year after all drilling activity has ceased.

10. Plans for Restoration of Surface

Dry Hole

a. Rehabilitation of the entire site will be required and will commence
immediately after the drilling is complete. The site will be restored as nearly
practical to its original condition. Cut and fill slopes will be reduced and
graded to conform to the adjacent terrain.

b. Drainages will be reestablished and temporary measures will be required to
prevent erosion to the site until vegetation is established.

c. Generally speaking, the standpipe for well identifications will be removed on
National Forest lands. A final determination will be made on a case-by-case
basis.

d. After final grading and before the replacement of topsoil, the entire surface of
the site shall be scarified to eliminate slippage surfaces and to promote root
penetration. Topsoil will then be spread over the site to achieve an



approximate uniform, stable thickness consistent with the established
contours.

e. A temporary fence will be constructed around the site until vegetation is
established. The fence will then be removed.

f, At such time as the well is plugged and abandoned, the operator shall submit a
subsequent report of abandonment.

Producing Location

a. Site reclamation for producing wells will be accomplished for portions of the
site not required for the continued operation of the well. All disturbed surface
will be treated to prevent erosion and to complement the esthetics of the area.
A new site plan will be required encompassing the facilities required for
operation and interim reclamation measures.

b. Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area will be
cleared of all unused tubing, equipment, debris, materials, trash and junk not
required for production.

c. Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons on the pit shall be
removed in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-1.

d. The plastic nylon reinforced liner shall be torn and perforated before
backfilling of the reserve pit.

e. At the end of drilling operations, drilling fluids will be hauled to an approve
disposal site. All polluting substances or contaminated materials, such as oil,
oil-saturated soil, and gravel, will be buried within a minimum of 2 feet of
clean soil as cover or be removed from the Forest.

f.  Once the reserve pit is dry, the reserve pit and that portion of the location not
needed for production facilities/operations will be recontoured to the
approximate natural contours.

g. The cut and fill slopes and all other disturbed areas not needed for the
production operation will be topsoiled and re-vegetated. The berm will be
removed and the site graded to drain.

h. The site will be seeded and/or planted as prescribed by the Forest Service.
This prescription will be determined prior to site construction on a site
specific basis. Nutrients and soil amendments will be applied to the
redistributed surface soil later as necessary to meet the re-vegetation
requirements. Fall seeding will be completed after September, and prior to
prolonged ground frost.



i. Annual or noxious weeds shall be controlled on all disturbed areas. Method
of control shall be by approved mechanical method or an Environmental
Protection Agency (EPA) registered herbicide. All herbicide application will
be in cooperation with Forest Service personel.

11. Surface Ownership

Access Roads — All roads are located within the Manti-La Sal National Forest.
Portions of the access road are located on private lands.

Well Pad — The well pad is located on lands managed by the Manti-La Sal
National Forest.

12. Other Information

a. A Class III cultural resource inventory will be completed prior to
disturbance by a qualified professional archaeologist.

b. The operator is responsible for informing all persons in the area who are
associated with this project that they will be subject to prosecution for
knowingly disturbing historic or archaeological sites, or for collecting
artifacts. If historic or archaeological materials are uncovered during
construction, the operator is to immediately stop work that might further
disturb such materials, and contact the authorized officer (AO). Within
five working days the AO will inform the operator to:

i. whether the materials appear eligible for the National Register of
Historic Places;

ii. the mitigation measures the operator will likely have to undertake
before the site can be used (assuming the site preservation is not
necessary); and

iii. atime frame for the AO to complete and expedited review under
36 CFR 800.11 to confirm, through the State Historic Preservation
Officer, that the findings of the AO are correct and that mitigation
is appropriate. If the operator wishes, at any time, to relocate
activities to avoid the expense of mitigation and/or the delays
associated with this process, the AO will assume responsibility for
whatever recordation and stabilization of the exposed materials
may be required. Otherwise, the operator will be responsible for
mitigation costs. The AO will provide technical and procedural
guidelines for the conduct of mitigation. Upon verification from
the AO that required mitigation has been completed, the operator
will then be allowed to resume construction.



c. Less than 10,000 pounds of any chemical(s) from the EPA’s Consolidated
list of Chemicals Subject to Reporting Under Title III of the Superfund
Amendments and Reauthorization Act (SARA) 0f 1986, as defined in 40
CFR, would be used, produces, transported, stored, disposed, or associated
with the proposed action.

d. All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that
full compliance is made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil
and Gas Orders, the approved plan of operations, and any applicable
Notice to Lessees. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his
subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished the field
representative to insure compliance.

e. A complete copy of the approved APD shall be on location during
construction of the location and drilling activities.

f  There will be no deviation from the proposed drilling and/or workover
program without prior approval from the AO. Safe drilling and operating
practices must be observed. All wells, whether drilling, producing,
suspended, or abandoned will be identified in accordance with 43 CFR
3162.h.

g. “Sundry Notice and Report on Wells” (Form 3160-5) will be filed for
approval for all changes of plans and other operations in accordance with
43 CFR 3162.3-2.

h. This permit will be valid for a period of one year from the date of
approval. An extension period may be granted, if requested, prior to the

expiration of the original approval period.

i. The operator or his contractor shall contact the U.S. Forest Service at 801-
637-2817 48 hours prior to construction activities.

13. Lessee’s or Operator’s Representative and Certification

Permit Matters

Marion Energy Inc./Mid-Power Resource Corp.
Keri Clarke

119 S. Tennessee Suite 200

McKinney, TX, 75069

(972)540-2967

Drilling & Completion Matters
Marion Energy Inc./Mid-Power Resource Corp.

2901 East 20 Street
Farmington, NM, 87402



Doug Endsley — V P Operations
(505)564-8005

Certification

I hereby certify that I, or Persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the
proposed drill site and access rout; that I am familiar with the conditions which
presently exist; that the statements made in this plan are, to the best of my
knowledge, true and correct; and, that the work associated with the operations
proposed herein will be performed by Anschutz Exploration Corp. and it’s
contractors and subcontractors in conformity with the plan and the terms and

- conditions under which it is approved.

This statement is subject to the provisions of 18.U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a
false statement.

$-5-04 QA@J\

Date Name



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore
Federal and Indian Oil and Gas Leases
Ridge Runner #1-30

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas Order
No. 1, and the approved plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the
actions of his subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished the field
representative to insure compliance.

1.

Estimated Tops/Geologic Markers

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Name TVD D Production Phase
Top of Emery 18754t 18491t Gas

Top of Blue Gate 3100ft 3413ft Gas

Top of Ferron 53191t 6350ft Gas

D 60191t 7276t

Estimated Depth of Qil, Gas Water and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas
or other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation Depth
Gas Ferron 5319°

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling,
will be recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be
tested to determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sand will be reported to the BLM in Moab,
Utah. Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If noticeable water
flows are detected, samples will be submitted to the BLM along with any water
analyses conducted.

BOP Equipment

Marion Energy Inc’s minimum specifications for pressure to control equipment
are as follows:

Ram Type: 117 Hydraulic double, 3000 psi w.p.



Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approve stack
working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 70 percent of internal yield pressure
of casing. Pressure shall be maintained for at least 10 minutes or until
requirements of test are met, whichever is longer. If a test plug is utilized, no
bleed-off pressure is acceptable. For a test not utilizing a test plug, if a decline is
pressure of more than 10 percent in 30 minutes occurs, the test shall be considered
to have failed. Valve on casing head below test plug shall be open during test of
BOP stack.

Annular type preventers (if used) shall be tested to 60 percent of rated working
pressure. Pressure shall be maintained at least 10 minutes or until provisions of
test are met, whichever is longer.

As a minimum, the above test shall be performed:

when initially installed;

whenever any seal subject to test pressure is broken
following related repairs; and

at 40-day intervals

e o

Valves shall be tested from working pressure side during BOPE tests with all
down stream valves open.

When testing the kill line valve(s) the check valve shall be held open or the ball
removed.

Annular preventers (if used) shall be functionally operated at least weekly.

Pipe and blind rams shall be activated each trip, however, this function need not
be performed more than once a day.

A BOPE pit level drill shall be conducted weekly for each drilling crew.

The BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimum requirements of
Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 for equipment and testing requirements,
procedures, etc., and individual components shall be operable ads designed.
Chart recorders shall be used for all pressure tests.

Pressure tests shall apply to all related well control equipment.

All of the above described tests and/or drills shall be recorded in the drilling log.

Test charts, with individual test results identified, shall be maintained on location
while drilling and shall be made available to a BLM representative upon request.

Pressure tests shall apply to all related well control equipment.



BOP systems shall be consistent with API RP53. Pressure tests will be conducted
before drilling out from under casing strings which have been set and cemented in
place. Blowout preventer controls will be installed prior to drilling the surface
casing plug and will remain in use until the well is completed or abandoned.
Preventers will be inspected and operated at least daily to ensure good mechanical
working order, and this inspection will be recorded on the daily drilling report.
Preventers will be pressure tested before drilling casing cement plugs.

The Price River Resource Area Office shall be notified, at least 24 hours prior to
initiating the pressure test, in order to have a BLM representative on location
during pressure testing.

a. The size and rating of the BOP stack is shown on the attached diagram.
Although a rig has not been chosen to drill this well, most of the equipment
for this depth of hole in the area use a 117, 3000 psi working pressure blowout
preventor.

b. A choke line and a kill line are to be properly installed. The kill line is not to
be used as a fill-up line.

c. The accumulator system shall have a pressure capacity to provide for repeated
operation of hydraulic preventers.

d. Drill string safety valve(s), to fit all tools in the drill string, are to be
maintained on the rig floor while drilling operations are in progress.

4. Casing and Cementing Program

a. The proposed casing and cementing program shall be conducted as approved
to protect and/or isolate all usable water zones, potentially productive zones,
lost circulation zones, abnormally pressured zones, and any prospectively
valuable deposits of minerals. Any isolating medium other than cement shall
receive approval prior to use. The casing setting depth shall be calculated to
position the casing seat opposite a competent formation which will contain the
maximum pressure to which it will be exposed during normal drilling
operations. Determination of casing setting depth shall be based on all
relevant factors, including; presence/absence of hydrocarbons; fractured
gradients; usable water zones; formation pressures; lost circulation zones;
other minerals; or other unusual characteristics. All indications of usable
water shall be reported

b. Casing design shall assume formation pressure gradients of 0.44 to 0.50 psi
per foot for exploratory wells (lacking better data).

c. Casing design shall assume fracture gradients from 0.70 to 1.00 psi per foot
for exploratory wells (lacking better data)



n.

Purpose

Casing collars shall have a minimum clearance of 0.422 inches of all sides in
the hole/casing annulus, with recognition that variances can be granted for
justified exceptions.

All waiting on cement times shall be adequate to achieve a minimum of 500
psi compressive strength at the casing shoe prior to drilling out.

All casing except the conductor casing, shall be new or reconditioned and
tested used casing that meets or exceeds API standards for new casing.

The surface casing shall be cemented back to surface either during the primary
cement job or by remedial cementing.

All indications of usable water shall be reported to the authorized officer prior
to running the next string of casing or before plugging orders are requested,
whichever occurs first.

Three centralizers will be run on the bottom three joints of surface casing with
a minimum of one centralizer per joint starting with the shoe joint.

Top plugs shall be used to reduce contamination of cement by displacement
fluid. A bottom plug or other acceptable technique, such as a suitable preflush
fluid, inner string cement method, etc. shall be utilized to help isolate the
cement from contamination by the mud fluid being displaced ahead of the
cement slurry.

All casing strings below the conductor shall be pressured tested to 0.22 psi per
foot of casing string length or 1500 psi, whichever is greater, but not to exceed
70 percent of the minimum internal yield. If pressure declines more than 10
percent in 30 minutes, corrective action shall be taken.

m. On all exploratory wells, and on that portion of any well approved for SM
BOPE system or greater, a pressure integrity test of each casing shoe shall be
performed. Formation at the shoe shall be tested to a minimum of the mud
weight equivalent anticipated to control the formation pressure to the next
casing depth or at total depth of the well. This test shall be performed before
drilling more than 20 feet of new hole.

The proposed casing program will be as follows:

Depth Hole Size 0O.D. Weight Grade Type New or Used

Surface
Intermed.
Produc.

0-500° 14 3/4” 10 3/4740.5# J-55 ST&C New
0-3450° 97/8” 7-5/8” 26.4# J-55 LT&C New
0-7250° 77/8” 5-1/2” 17# J-55 LT&C New

Casing design subject to revision based on geologic conditions encountered.



p. Please refer to DOGM Form 3 for the Cement program associated with this
well.

q. The price River Resource Area Office should be notified, with sufficient lead
time, in order to have a BLM representative on location while running all
casing strings and cementing.

r. After cementing but before commencing any test, the casing string shall stand
cemented until the cement has reached a compressive strength of at least 500
psi at the shoe. WOC time shall be recorded in the driller’s log.

s. The following reports shall be filed with the District Manager within 30 days
after the work is completed.

1. Progress reports, Form 3160-5 (formerly 9-331) “Sundry
Notices and Reports on Wells”, must include complete
information concerning:

a. Setting of each string of casing, showing the size,
grade, weight of casing set, hole size, setting depth,
amounts and type of cement used, whether cement
circulated or the top of the cement behind the casing,
depth of cementing tools used, casing test method and
results, and the date work was done. Show the spud
date on the first reports submitted.

b. Temperature of bond logs must be submitted for each
well where the casing cement was not circulated to the
surface.

t. Auxiliary equipment to be used is as follows:
1. Kelly cock
2. No bit float is deemed necessary.
3. A sub with a full opening valve.
5. Mud Program

a. The purpose circulating mediums to be employed in drilling are as follows:

Interval Mud Type Mud Wt. Visc. F/L PH
0-500° Spud Mud

500-3450° LSND 8.8-9.2 32-40 8-15 ---



3450°-T.D. Air/Foam N/A N/A N/A ---

There will be sufficient mud on location to control a blowout should one
ocCCur,

A mud test shall be performed every 24 hours after mudding up to determine,
as applicable: density, viscosity, gel strength, static filtration loss, and Ph.

b. Mud monitoring equipment to be used is as follows:

1. Periodic checks will be made each tour of the mud system. The mud level
will be checked visually.

c. Hazardous substances specifically listed by the EPA as a hazardous waste or
demonstrating a characteristic of a hazardous waste will not be used in

drilling, testing or completion operations.

6. Evaluation Program

The anticipated type of amount of testing, logging and coring are as follows:

a. No drill stem tests are anticipated, however, if DST’s are run, the following
requirements will be adhered to:

Initial opening of drill stem test tools shall be restricted to daylight hours
unless specific approval to start during other hours is obtained from the
authorized officer. However, DST’s may be allowed to continue at night if
the test was initiated during daylight hours and the rate of flow is stabilized
and if adequate lighting is available (i.e. lighting which is adequate for
visibility and vapor-proof for safe operations). Packers can be released, but
tripping shall not begin before daylight, unless prior approval is obtained from
the authorized officer. Closed chamber DSTs may be accomplished day or
night.

A DST that flows to the surface with evidence of hydrocarbons shall be either
reversed out of the testing string under controlled surface conditions. This
would involve provided some means for reverse circulation.

Separation equipment required for the anticipated recovery shall be properly
installed before a test starts.

All engines within 100 feet of the wellbore that are required to “run” during
the test shall have spark arresters or water cooled exhausts.

b. The logging program will consist of a DIL-SFL-GR-SP and BHC
Sonic GR_CAL will be run from surface to 5710°. A DIL-SFL-GR-SP,



ASPN-LDT-DR-CAL, Digital Dipole shear Sonic-GR-CAL and FMI-GR will
be run from 5710’ to T.D.

c. Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, “Well
Completion and Recompletion Report and Log’ (Form 3160-4) will be
submitted no later than 30 days after completion of the well or after
completion of operations being performed, in accordance with 43 CFR 3164.
Two copies of all logs, core descriptions, core analyses, well-test data,
geologic summaries, sample description, and all other surveys or data
obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover, and/or completion
operations, will be filed with form3160-4. Samples (cuttings, fluids, and/or
gases) will be submitted when requested by the authorized officer (AO).

d. The anticipated completion program is as follows:
Perforate Ferron w/ 3-3/8” casing gun @ 6 jspf using 23 gram charges. Break
down formation with 2000 gallons of Formic acid. Fracture stimulate
formation w/ 25# Cross linked x-Linked Gel and 200,0001bs of 16/30 mesh

sand.

1. Anticipated Pressures and H,S

a. The expected bottom hole pressure is 1200 psi. Low pressures are anticipated.
b. No hydrogen sulfide gas is anticipated.

2. Other Information and Notification Requirements

a. Should the well be successfully completed for production, the AO will be
notified when the well is placed in a producing status. Such notification will
be sent by telegram or other written communications, not later than 5 days
following the date on which the well is placed on production.

b. Production data shall be reported to the MMS pursuant to 30 CFR 216.5 using
form MMS/3160.

c. The data on which production is commenced or resumed will be construed for
oil wells as the date on which liquid hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped
from a temporary storage facility, such as a test tank, and for which a run
ticket is required to be generated or, the date on which liquid hydrocarbons are
first produced into a permanent storage facility, whichever first occurs; and,
for gas wells as the date on which associated liquid hydrocarbons are first sold
or shipped from a temporary storage facility, such as a test tank, and for which
a run ticket is required to be generated or the date on which gas is first
measured though permanent metering facilities, whichever first occurs.



. Pursuant to NTL-4A, lessees or operators are authorized to vent/flare gas
during initial well evaluation tests, not exceeding a period of 30 days or the
production of 50 MMCF of gas, whichever occurs first. An application must
be filed with the District Engineer and approval received, for any
venting/flaring of gas beyond the initial 30 day or authorized test period.

Gas produced from this well may not be vented or flared beyond an initial
authorized test period of 30 days or 50 MMCF following its completion,
whichever occurs first, without the prior written approval of the Authorized
Officer. Should gas be vented or flared without approval beyond the
authorized test period, the operator may be directed to shut-in the well until
the gas can be captured or the operator shall be required to compensate the
lesser for that portion of the gas vented or flared without approval which is
determined to have been avoidably lost.

A schematic facilities diagram as required by 43 CFR 3162.7-2, 3162.7-3 and
3162.7-4 shall be submitted to the appropriate District Office within 30 days
of installation or first production, whichever occurs first. All site security
regulations as specified in 43 CFR 3162.7 and Onshore Order No.3 shall be
adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks
will be effectively sealed in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-4.

Section 102(b)(3) of the Federal Oil and Gas Royalty Management Act of
1982, as implemented by the applicable provisions of the operating
regulations at Title 43 CFR 3162.4-1(c), requires that “not later than the 5
business day after any well begins production on which royalty is due
anywhere on a lease site or allocated to a lease site, or resumes production in
the case of a well which has been off production for more than 90 days, the
operator shall notify the authorized officer by letter or sundry notice, Form
3160-5, or orally to be followed by a letter or sundry notice, of the date on
which such production has begun or resumed.”

If you fail to comply with this requirement in the manner and time allowed,
you shall be liable for a civil penalty of up to $10,000 per violation for each
day such violation continues, not to exceed a maximum of 20 days. See
Section 109 (3) of the Federal Oil and Gas Royalty Management Act of 1982
and the implementing regulations at Title 43 CFR 3162.4-1(b)(5)(ii).

. Drilling will commence on approximately June 30, 1996 to avoid wither
operations within the forest.

It is anticipated that the drilling of this well will take approximately 30 days.
No location will be constructed or moved, no well will be plugged, and no

drilling or workover equipment will be removed from a well to be placed in a
suspended status without prior approval of the AO. If operations are to be



suspended, prior approval of the AO will be obtained and notification given
before resumption of operations.

. Immediate Report: Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents, or any other
unusual occurrences shall be promptly reported in accordance with the
requirements of NTL-3A or its revision.

If a replacement rig is contemplated for completion operations, a “Sundry
Notice” Form 3160-5 to that effect will be filed, for prior approval of the AO,
and all conditions of this approved plan are applicable during all operations
conducted with the replacement rig.

. Pursuant to Onshore Order No. 7, with the approval of the District Engineer,
produced water may be temporarily disposed of into unlined pits for a period
of up to 90 days. During the period so authorized, and application for
approval of the permanent disposal method, along with the required water
analysis and other information must be submitted to the District Engineer.

. No well abandonment operations will be commenced without the prior
approval of the AO. In the case of newly drilled dry holes or failures, and in
emergency situations, oral approval will be obtained from the SO> A
“Subsequent Report of Abandonment” Form 3160-5, will be filed with the AO
within 30 days following completion of the well for abandonment. This
report will indicate where plugs were placed and the current status of surface
restoration. Final abandonment will not be approved until the surface
reclamation work required by the approved APD or approved abandonment
notice has been completed to the satisfaction of the AO or his representative
or the appropriate Surface Managing Agency.



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OlL, GAS AND MINING

Request to Transfer Application or Permit to Drill

(This form should accompany a Sundry Notice, Form 9, requesting APD transfer)

Well name: Ridge Runner # 1-30

APl number: 4301530680

Location: - NESW Seotor 20 Dowareide o 148 Hoaee TE
Company that filed original application: | Mid-Power Resource Corporation

Date original permit was issued: 04/26/2006

Company that permit was issued to: Mid-Power Resource Corporation

Check

one Desired Action:

Transfer pending (unapproved) Application for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property, hereby verifies that the information as
submitted in the pending Application for Permit to Drill, remains valid and does not require revision. The new
owner of the application accepts and agrees to the information and procedures as stated in the application.

v | Transfer approved Application for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted, hereby verifies that the
information as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require
revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which shouid be verified. Yes | No

<~

If located on private land, has the ownership changed?

If so, has the surface agreement been updated?

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect the spacing or siting
requirements for this location?

Have there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permitting or operation of this
proposed well?

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership or right-of-way, which could affect the
proposed location?

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed?

SIS SNK S

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a change in
plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation?

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? Bond No. B001617 v

Any desired or necessary changes to either a pending or approved Application for Permit to Drill that is being transferred,
should be filed on a Sundry Notice, Form 9, or amended Application for Permit to Drill, Form 3, as appropriate, with
necessary supporting information as required.

Name (please print) Benjamin Evans Title Landman
- —
Signature Fi e Date 05/09/2006

Representing (company name) Marion Energy Inc.

The person signing this form must have legal authority to represent the company or individual(s) to be listed as the new operator on the Application for
Permit to Drill. o -

(3/2004)

MAY 0 3 7500



United States Department of the Interior E}‘
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT -m

Utah State Office TAKE PRIOE"
P.O. Box 45155 INAMERICA
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
uT-922

May 9, 2006

Marion Energy Inc.
119 South Tennessee, Suite 200
McKinney, Texas 75069

Re: Clear Creek Unit
Carbon & Emery Counties, Utah

Gentlemen:

On May 8, 2006, we received an indenture dated April 28, 2006, whereby Mid-Power Resource
Corporation resigned as Unit Operator and Marion Energy Inc. was designated as Successor
Unit Operator for the Clear Creek Unit, Carbon & Emery Counties, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effective May 9, 2006.
In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the
designated party has obtained all required approval that would entitle it to conduct operations under
the Clear Creek Unit Agreement.

Your Utah statewide oil and gas bond No. UTB000179 will be used to cover all federal operations
within the Clear Creek Unit.

It is requested that you notify all interested parties of the change in unit operator. Copies of the
approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriate federal offices, with one copy returned
herewith.

Sincerely,
/s/ James A. Fouts

for Douglas F. Cook
Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals
Enclosure

bce:  Field Manager - Moab (w/enclosure)
SITLA
Division of QOil, Gas & Mining
File - Clear Creek Unit (w/enclosure)

Agr. Sec. Chron RECEIVED
Reading File
Central Files MAY 1 1 2006

UT922:TAThompson:tt:5/9/06 DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



STA(E OF UTAH FORM S

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU - 0L3018)

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME: |

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new welis, significantly deepen existing welis below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
ril horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. lreaR  Chcex Ul r
3. WELL NAME and NUMBER.

. TYPE OF WELL
OILWELL D GAS WELL m OTHER
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: . 9. AP NUMBER:
Mid- Powser Aesoucce.  (orporation
PHONE NUMBER: 10, FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT.

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: & .
%3290 W. SARARA A, (Rl LAS VEGAS . NV .. §9117 703)83%- 0 V¢ |8LeAR (AEEK FEDERAL UMIT

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: N A county: lARBON) ROD EMERY

QTR/GTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:  p) A STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION _ TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
[0 NoTICE OF INTENT U g g
(Submit in Duphicate) [ actercasine [] FRACTURE TREAT [[J siDETRACKTOREPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start [] casinrePar ] new consTRUCTION [T] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[J cHaNGE TOPREVIOUS PLANS ] oreraToR CHANGE [ vuenc RePar
[ cranceTUBING [J prucanpasanDoN ] ventorrAAre
[0 suBSEQUENT REPORT ] cHaNGE WELL NAME [ Puesack [[] warter DisrosaL
(Submit Originat Form Only)
[0 cranceweLL STATUS [[] PRODUCTION (STARTRESUME) [ water snut-oFF
Date of work completion:
[ coMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ recLamaTion oF weLL SITE O omer:
[ converTweLL Tvre [} RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearty show all pertinert details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

M:d-Powec &QSOU.(‘QQ 0or\PanuEwr\/‘f-L.L dc.s«%na-—{zd O?L'f‘&?\-
MNesigns  Bs Ueit Operator] eSSective wpord e ﬂ(){)r‘oua-\ o0& +Hha

Suteessor Uwt 0 peveter, MARION ENERQY Troe . Mid-Fower Aesauree_
prgkpo@{d%@ AND A]oprovcs +his Q,L\Awac_

or of ‘he wo]‘t/

Pp\eA&e reker 4o At Documenst s Submitred bq_I MurioR EUC)"B/’-]A_S
SUCLLsSo up'u*\-@(‘)wwtor* AOD oo Beha (€ of Mid- Rraer P}esoucg

Ne (dmé‘ ‘s C‘J’\V&Mée .

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Suysan 77\”“&'0(—!' TITLE @%_éf)\w@
/j')&l.—clf ?. 2eec

SIGNATURE ‘M /A‘fﬂ\w’\ DATE

(This space for State use only)

| | . | RECEIVED
APPROVED_Q://X’&G oo T : MAY 12 2006

(5/2000) Da"-/‘/w W (See instructions on Reverse Side)
ivision of Oil, Gas and Mining DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

Earlene Russell, Engineering Technician




STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERWIL NUMBER:

UTU-063018X

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drili horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Clear Creek Unit

1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

(o] LL GAS WEL OTHER
Lwew O] L4 E See Attachment "A"
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APl NUMBER:
Marion Energy Inc. (N2740)
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT.
119 S Tennessee Ste #200 .., McKinney stare TX 5. 75069 (972) 540-2967 Clear Creek Federal unit
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: N/A county: Carbon and Emery
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: N/A STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[ acioze [] oeepren [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
/] NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) [] ALter casing [[] FRACTURE TREAT [J sibETRACKTO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [[] casincrerar [C] NewconsTRUCTION [C] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[J crance To PREVIOUS PLANS [/] oPeraToR cHange 7] TusiNG RePAR
[] crance TuBiNG [] PLuG AND ABANDON [C] ventorFLARE
[CJ sueseQueNT REPORT [[] cHANGEWELL NAME [] rpuseack [} water DisposaL
(Submit Originat Form Only)
[J cHanGE weLL STATUS [] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [ warer sHuT-oFF
Date of work completion:
[] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE ] orher:
[T] converT weLL TYPE [ RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Marion Energy Inc. will take over operation of the Clear Creek Federal Unit which is currently operated by Mid-Power Resource

Corporation, and is located in both Carbon and Emery Counties Utah.

Please See attachment "A" for well Names, APl numbers, and legal descriptions

BLm Bond = ({ TBO00IT79
ecial Borol = BOOATTS
State +Fee Pond = B0 0/blT

EfPeative 4/a8)anse

N335

TITLE

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Keri C'a”y‘ (74-3 {\

Vice President Land (Marion Energy Inc)

=L O

SIGNATURE DATE

< [ ‘6(06

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED J //8[06

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Earlene Russell, Engineering Techniclan

ONINIA 8 SY9 11040 'Na

P 3
£ I3

a3anizo3d



Well Name
Utah Fuel No.

Utah Fuel No.
Utah Fuel No.
Utah Fuel No.
Utah Fuel No.
Utah Fuel No.
Utah Fuel No. 10

Utah State M.L. 1256-1
Oman 2-20

Utah Fuel A-1

o O~ W N =

Alpine School District #6-17
Alpine School District #3-17

Ridge Runner 11-20
Ridge Runner 13-17
Ridge Runner #1-30
Ridge Runner #7-20
Ridge Runner #8-19
Ridge Runner #2-18
Ridge Runner #11-18
Ridge Runner #11-17
* Not Yet Spudded

Attachment A
Marion Energy Inc.

Clear Creek Unit
Carbon and Emery Counties, Utah

APl Number
43-007-16009-00-00

43-007-16010-00-00
43-007-16011-00-00
43-007-16012-00-00
43-007-16013-00-00
43-007-16015-00-00
43-007-16016-00-00
43-007-30102-00-00
43-007-30289-00-00
43-015-16021-00-00
43-007-31181-00-00
43-007-31182-00-00
43-015-30271-00-00
43-015-30269-00-00
43-015-30680-00-00
43-015-30681-00-00
43-015-30682-00-00
43-015-30683-00-00
43-015-30684-00-00
43-015-30685-00-00

Wells

Status
Shut-in

Shut-in

Shut-in

Shut-in

Plugged and Abandoned
Shut-in

Shut-in

Shut-in

Shut-in

Plugged and Abandoned
Permit not yet Approved
Permit not yet Approved
Shut-in

Shut-in

Approved APD (NYS)*
Approved APD (NYS)*
Approved APD (NYS)*
Approved APD (NYS)*
Approved APD (NYS)*
Approved APD (NYS)*

Section
Township

—Range
.5 T14S R7E

.32 T13S R7E
.32 T13S R7E
.30 T13SR7E
.31 T13S R7E
.19 T13S R7E
.5T14S R7E

.29T13S7E

.20 T13S R7E
.6T14S R7E

.17 T13S R7E
.17 T13S R7E
.20 T14S R7E
.17 T14S R7E
.20 T14SR7E
.20 T14S R7E
.20 T14S R7E
.17 T14SR7E
.17 T14S R7E
.17 T14S R7E

mw o nnuooononuonenoonononoonononoononnonon

Plugged Wells or Abandoned Well Sites in area (noted but not changed)

Clear Creek 1

Clear Creek Unit No. 16
Clear Creek Unit No. 17
G W Deck A-1

Gov't 1-17

Kearns A-1

Kemmerer Coal 1
Kemmerer Coal 2

C. K. Steiner A-1

Utah Fuel No. 7

H. E. Walton No. 1

H.E. Walton A-3

P. T. Walton No. 1-X
Clear Creek Water Well 1
Deck 1

Clear Creek U 18

1-18

P.T. Walton 1

Clear Creek Unit 1
Clear Creek (Deep) 2

43-007-20068-00-00
43-015-16018-00-00
43-015-30053-00-00
43-007-16008-00-00
43-007-11179-00-00
43-015-11217-00-00
43-015-10897-00-00
43-015-10304-00-00
43-015-10306-00-00
43-007-16014-00-00
43-007-16017-00-00
43-015-16023-00-00
43-015-16024-00-00
43-007-20119-00-00
43-007-20356-00-00
43-007-30043-00-00
43-015-20300-00-00
43-015-20302-00-00
43-015-30090-00-00
43-015-30307-00-00

Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Location Abandoned

Location Abandoned

Location Abandoned

Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Location Abandoned

S. 17 T14S R7E
S.29 T14S R7E
S.20 T14S R7E
S.8T14S R7E

S$.17 T14S R7E
S.32 T14S R7E
S. 24 T14S R6E
S. 24 T14S R6E
S.5T15S8 R7E

S. 17 T13S R7E
S. 17 T14S R7E
S.30T14S R7E
S. 19 T14SR7E
S. 17 T14S R7E
S.8T14S R7E

S.20T13SR7E
S.18 T14S R7E
S. 19 T14S R7E
S.19T14S R7E
S. 19 T14S R7E



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH
2. CDW
3. FILE
X Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent/Operator
Operator Name Change Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 4/28/2006
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2215-Mid-Power Resource Corporation N2740-Marion Energy, Inc.
8290 W Sahara Ave #186 119 S Tennessee, Suite 200
Las Vegas, NV 89117 McKinney, TX 75069
Phone: 1-(702) 838-0716 Phone: 1-(972) 540-2967
CA No. Unit: CLEAR CREEK
WELL(S)
NAME SEC TWN RNGJ|API NO ENTITY |LEASE |WELL |WELL
NO TYPE TYPE | STATUS
RIDGE RUNNER 13-17 17 1408 |070E 4301530269 2550]Federal GW TA
RIDGE RUNNER 2-18 17 1408 JO70E |4301530683 Federal GW APD
RIDGE RUNNER 11-18 17 |140S |O70E [4301530684 Federal GW APD
RIDGE RUNNER 11-17 17 11408 |070E |4301530685 Federal GW APD
RIDGE RUNNER 11-20 20 |1408 JO70E [4301530271 2550]Federal GW TA
RIDGE RUNNER 1-30 20 1140S JO70E |4301530680 Federal GW APD
RIDGE RUNNER 7-20 20 |140S |070E [4301530681 Federal GW APD
RIDGE RUNNER 8-19 20 {140S |070E |4301530682 Federal GW APD
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: ~ 5/12/2006
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 5/8/2006
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 4/7/2005
Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 5868337-0143

5. IfNO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

6a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE
6b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a

Marion Energy 2 FORM 4A.xis 5/18/2006



7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 5/9/2006 _ BIA n/a

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: not yet

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ('"'CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: n/a
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 5/18/2006
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 5/18/2006
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 5/18/2006
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 5/18/2006
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: n/a
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: 5/9/2006

FEDERAL WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: UTB000179

INDIAN WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: n/a

FEE & STATE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number n/a

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on:
The Division sent response by letter on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on:

COMMENTS:

Marion Energy 2 FORM 4A.xls 5/18/2006



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 3

AMENDED REPORT [/]
(highlight changes)

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

5. MINERAL LEASE NO: 6. SURFACE:

USA-U-02353 Federal

DRILL /] REENTER [ peEePeN [

oL [ cas

1A. TYPE OF WORK:

B. TYPE OF WELL: OTHER

SINGLE ZONE /] MULTIPLE ZONE []

7. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

8. UNIT or CA AGREEMBNT NAME:
Clear Creek Unit

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
Mid-Power Resource Corporation

9. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

Ridge Runner # 1-30

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER:

10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

8290 W. Sahara, # 186 ., Las Vegas grore NV, 89117 (702) 838-0716 Wildcat
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) 1. QéI'SIQTR. SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,
MERIDIAN:
atsurrace. 1719.25 FWL 1502.88ft FSL /SW/4 Section 20 14S-7E NESW 20 14S 7E
AT PROPOSED PRODUCNG ZONE:  246ft FEL 707ft FNL/NE Section 30 14S-7E
14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:
Approx 5 miles south of Clear Creek Emery UTAH
15. DISTANCE TO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE (FEET) 16. NUMBER OF ACRES IN LEASE: 17. NUMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:
Surface 1674ft Bottom Hole 707ft 2375.28 40
18. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING, COMPLETED, OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:
APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET)
Surface 20ft Bottom Hole 2950ft 6,050 See Attached Bond Document
21. ELEVATIONS (SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATE DATE WORK WILL START: 23. ESTIMATED DURATION:
9,815 GR 7/1/2006 30 days
24, PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY, YIELD, AND SLURRY WEIGHT
17 1/2" 13 3/8" J-55 61# 500 | Premium "G" 420 sks 1.25 cuft/sk 14.2 ppg
12 1/4" 8 5/8" J-55 36# 3,450 | Lead: Prem. Lite 320 sks 3.82 cuft/sk 11 ppg
Tail: 50/50 Poz 755 sks  1.25 cuft/sk 14.2 ppg
778 51/2 J-55 17# 7,250 | Lead: Prem. Lite 496 sks  3.82 cuft/sk 11 ppg
Tail: 50/50 Poz 275 sks  1.25 cuft/sk 14.2 ppg
25. ATTACHMENTS

VERIFY THE FOLLOWNG ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCEWTH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES:

m WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER m COMPLETE DRILLING PLAN

L—_-] EVIDENCE OF DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER

D FORM 5. IF OPERATOR 1S PERSON OR COMPANY OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

NAME (PLEASE PRIvT) BENjamIN Evans( e -andman
—— N -~ — g7
SIGNATURE \3 é— VV/() DATE :) / I Q /0 é'/
(This space for State use only)
RECEIVED
API NUMBER ASSIGNED: L/ﬁ“ (&) /S— 3 0 6 g [o] APPROVAL:

{11/2001}) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

MAY 2 2 2006
OIV. OF OIL. GAS & MiNING



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore
Federal and Indian Oil and Gas Leases
Ridge Runner #1-30

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas Order
No. 1, and the approved plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the
actions of his subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished the field
representative to insure compliance.

1. Estimated Tops/Geologic Markers

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Name TVD D Production Phase
Top of Emery 18754t 18491t Gas

Top of Blue Gate 31001t 3413ft Gas

Top of Ferron 53194t 6350ft Gas

TD 60191t 7276ft

2 Estimated Depth of Qil, Gas Water and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas
or other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation Depth
Gas Ferron 5319’

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling,
will be recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be
tested to determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sand will be reported to the BLM in Moab,
Utah. Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If noticeable water
flows are detected, samples will be submitted to the BLM along with any water
analyses conducted.

3. BOP Equipment

Marion Energy Inc’s minimum specifications for pressure to control equipment
are as follows:

Ram Type: 11” Hydraulic double, 3000 psi w.p.



Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approve stack
working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 70 percent of internal yield pressure
of casing. Pressure shall be maintained for at least 10 minutes or until
requirements of test are met, whichever is longer. If a test plug is utilized, no
bleed-off pressure is acceptable. For a test not utilizing a test plug, if a decline is
pressure of more than 10 percent in 30 minutes occurs, the test shall be considered
to have failed. Valve on casing head below test plug shall be open during test of
BOP stack.

Annular type preventers (if used) shall be tested to 60 percent of rated working
pressure. Pressure shall be maintained at least 10 minutes or until provisions of
test are met, whichever is longer.

As a minimum, the above test shall be performed:

a. when initially installed;

b. whenever any seal subject to test pressure is broken
c. following related repairs; and

d. at40-day intervals

Valves shall be tested from working pressure side during BOPE tests with all
down stream valves open.

When testing the kill line valve(s) the check valve shall be held open or the ball
removed.

Annular preventers (if used) shall be functionally operated at least weekly.

Pipe and blind rams shall be activated each trip, however, this function need not
be performed more than once a day.

A BOPE pit level drill shall be conducted weekly for each drilling crew.

The BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimum requirements of
Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 for equipment and testing requirements,
procedures, etc., and individual components shall be operable ads designed.
Chart recorders shall be used for all pressure tests.

Pressure tests shall apply to all related well control equipment.

All of the above described tests and/or drills shall be recorded in the drilling log.

Test charts, with individual test results identified, shall be maintained on location
while drilling and shall be made available to a BLM representative upon request.

Pressure tests shall apply to all related well control equipment.



BOP systems shall be consistent with API RP53. Pressure tests will be conducted
before drilling out from under casing strings which have been set and cemented in
place. Blowout preventer controls will be installed prior to drilling the surface
casing plug and will remain in use until the well is completed or abandoned.
Preventers will be inspected and operated at least daily to ensure good mechanical
working order, and this inspection will be recorded on the daily drilling report.
Preventers will be pressure tested before drilling casing cement plugs.

The Price River Resource Area Office shall be notified, at least 24 hours prior to
initiating the pressure test, in order to have a BLM representative on location
during pressure testing.

a. The size and rating of the BOP stack is shown on the attached diagram.
Although a rig has not been chosen to drill this well, most of the equipment
for this depth of hole in the area use a 117, 3000 psi working pressure blowout
preventor.

b. A choke line and a kill line are to be properly installed. The kill line is not to
be used as a fill-up line.

c. The accumulator system shall have a pressure capacity to provide for repeated
operation of hydraulic preventers.

d. Drill string safety valve(s), to fit all tools in the drill string, are to be
maintained on the rig floor while drilling operations are in progress.

4. Casing and Cementing Program

a. The proposed casing and cementing program shall be conducted as approved
to protect and/or isolate all usable water zones, potentially productive zones,
lost circulation zones, abnormally pressured zones, and any prospectively
valuable deposits of minerals. Any isolating medium other than cement shall
receive approval prior to use. The casing setting depth shall be calculated to
position the casing seat opposite a competent formation which will contain the
maximum pressure to which it will be exposed during normal drilling
operations. Determination of casing setting depth shall be based on all
relevant factors, including; presence/absence of hydrocarbons; fractured
gradients; usable water zones; formation pressures; lost circulation zones;
other minerals; or other unusual characteristics. All indications of usable
water shall be reported

b. Casing design shall assume formation pressure gradients of 0.44 to 0.50 psi
per foot for exploratory wells (lacking better data).

c. Casing design shall assume fracture gradients from 0.70 to 1.00 psi per foot
for exploratory wells (lacking better data)



n.

Purpose
Surface

Intermed.
Produc.

Casing collars shall have a minimum clearance of 0.422 inches of all sides in
the hole/casing annulus, with recognition that variances can be granted for
justified exceptions.

All waiting on cement times shall be adequate to achieve a minimum of 500
psi compressive strength at the casing shoe prior to drilling out.

All casing except the conductor casing, shall be new or reconditioned and
tested used casing that meets or exceeds API standards for new casing.

The surface casing shall be cemented back to surface either during the primary
cement job or by remedial cementing.

All indications of usable water shall be reported to the authorized officer prior
to running the next string of casing or before plugging orders are requested,
whichever occurs first.

Three centralizers will be run on the bottom three joints of surface casing with
a minimum of one centralizer per joint starting with the shoe joint.

Top plugs shall be used to reduce contamination of cement by displacement
fluid. A bottom plug or other acceptable technique, such as a suitable preflush
fluid, inner string cement method, etc. shall be utilized to help isolate the
cement from contamination by the mud fluid being displaced ahead of the
cement slurry.

All casing strings below the conductor shall be pressured tested to 0.22 psi per
foot of casing string length or 1500 psi, whichever is greater, but not to exceed
70 percent of the minimum internal yield. If pressure declines more than 10
percent in 30 minutes, corrective action shall be taken.

m. On all exploratory wells, and on that portion of any well approved for 5SM
BOPE system or greater, a pressure integrity test of each casing shoe shall be
performed. Formation at the shoe shall be tested to a minimum of the mud
weight equivalent anticipated to control the formation pressure to the next
casing depth or at total depth of the well. This test shall be performed before
drilling more than 20 feet of new hole.

The proposed casing program will be as follows:

Depth Hole Size 0O.D. Weight Grade Type New or Used

0-500° 17 1/2” 13 3/8761# J-55 ST&C  New
0-3450> 12 1/4” 8-5/8” 36# J-55 LT&C New
0-7250° 77/8” 5-1/2" 17# J-55 LT&C New

Casing design subject to revision based on geologic conditions encountered.



p. Please refer to DOGM Form 3 for the Cement program associated with this
well.

q. The price River Resource Area Office should be notified, with sufficient lead
time, in order to have a BLM representative on location while running all
casing strings and cementing.

r. After cementing but before commencing any test, the casing string shall stand
cemented until the cement has reached a compressive strength of at least 500
psi at the shoe. WOC time shall be recorded in the driller’s log.

s. The following reports shall be filed with the District Manager within 30 days
after the work is completed.

1. Progress reports, Form 3160-5 (formerly 9-331) “Sundry
Notices and Reports on Wells”, must include complete
information concerning:

a. Setting of each string of casing, showing the size,
grade, weight of casing set, hole size, setting depth,
amounts and type of cement used, whether cement
circulated or the top of the cement behind the casing,
depth of cementing tools used, casing test method and
results, and the date work was done. Show the spud
date on the first reports submitted.

b. Temperature of bond logs must be submitted for each
well where the casing cement was not circulated to the
surface.

t. Auxiliary equipment to be used is as follows:
1. Kelly cock
2. No bit float is deemed necessary.
3. A sub with a full opening valve.
5. Mud Program

a. The purpose circulating mediums to be employed in drilling are as follows:

Interval Mud Type Mud Wt. Visc. F/L PH
0-500° Spud Mud

500-3450° LSND 8.8-9.2 32-40 8-15 ---



3450°-T.D. Air/Foam N/A N/A N/A ---

There will be sufficient mud on location to control a blowout should one
occur.

A mud test shall be performed every 24 hours after mudding up to determine,
as applicable: density, viscosity, gel strength, static filtration loss, and Ph.

b. Mud monitoring equipment to be used is as follows:

1. Periodic checks will be made each tour of the mud system. The mud level
will be checked visually.

c. Hazardous substances specifically listed by the EPA as a hazardous waste or
demonstrating a characteristic of a hazardous waste will not be used in

drilling, testing or completion operations.

6. Evaluation Program

The anticipated type of amount of testing, logging and coring are as follows:

a. No drill stem tests are anticipated, however, if DST’s are run, the following
requirements will be adhered to:

Initial opening of drill stem test tools shall be restricted to daylight hours
unless specific approval to start during other hours is obtained from the
authorized officer. However, DST’s may be allowed to continue at night if
the test was initiated during daylight hours and the rate of flow is stabilized
and if adequate lighting is available (i.e. lighting which is adequate for
visibility and vapor-proof for safe operations). Packers can be released, but
tripping shall not begin before daylight, unless prior approval is obtained from
the authorized officer. Closed chamber DSTs may be accomplished day or
night.

A DST that flows to the surface with evidence of hydrocarbons shall be either
reversed out of the testing string under controlled surface conditions. This
would involve provided some means for reverse circulation.

Separation equipment required for the anticipated recovery shall be properly
installed before a test starts.

All engines within 100 feet of the wellbore that are required to “run” during
the test shall have spark arresters or water cooled exhausts.

b. The logging program will consist of a DIL-SFL-GR-SP and BHC
Sonic. GR_CAL will be run from surface to 5710°. A DIL-SFL-GR-SP,



ASPN-LDT-DR-CAL, Digital Dipole shear Sonic-GR-CAL and FMI-GR will
be run from 5710° to T.D.

c. Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, “Well
Completion and Recompletion Report and Log’ (Form 3160-4) will be
submitted no later than 30 days after completion of the well or after
completion of operations being performed, in accordance with 43 CFR 3164.
Two copies of all logs, core descriptions, core analyses, well-test data,
geologic summaries, sample description, and all other surveys or data
obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover, and/or completion
operations, will be filed with form3160-4. Samples (cuttings, fluids, and/or
gases) will be submitted when requested by the authorized officer (AO).

d. The anticipated completion program is as follows:
Perforate Ferron w/ 3-3/8” casing gun @ 6 jspf using 23 gram charges. Break
down formation with 2000 gallons of Formic acid. Fracture stimulate

formation w/ 25# Cross linked x-Linked Gel and 200,0001bs of 16/30 mesh
sand.

1. Anticipated Pressures and H,S

a. The expected bottom hole pressure is 1200 psi. Low pressures are anticipated.
b. No hydrogen sulfide gas is anticipated.

2. Other Information and Notification Requirements

a. Should the well be successfully completed for production, the AO will be
notified when the well is placed in a producing status. Such notification will
be sent by telegram or other written communications, not later than 5 days
following the date on which the well is placed on production.

b. Production data shall be reported to the MMS pursuant to 30 CFR 216.5 using
form MMS/3160.

c. The data on which production is commenced or resumed will be construed for
oil wells as the date on which liquid hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped
from a temporary storage facility, such as a test tank, and for which a run
ticket is required to be generated or, the date on which liquid hydrocarbons are
first produced into a permanent storage facility, whichever first occurs; and,
for gas wells as the date on which associated liquid hydrocarbons are first sold
or shipped from a temporary storage facility, such as a test tank, and for which
a run ticket is required to be generated or the date on which gas is first
measured though permanent metering facilities, whichever first occurs.



. Pursuant to NTL-4A, lessees or operators are authorized to vent/flare gas
during initial well evaluation tests, not exceeding a period of 30 days or the
production of 50 MMCF of gas, whichever occurs first. An application must
be filed with the District Engineer and approval received, for any
venting/flaring of gas beyond the initial 30 day or authorized test period.

Gas produced from this well may not be vented or flared beyond an initial
authorized test period of 30 days or 50 MMCF following its completion,
whichever occurs first, without the prior written approval of the Authorized
Officer. Should gas be vented or flared without approval beyond the
authorized test period, the operator may be directed to shut-in the well until
the gas can be captured or the operator shall be required to compensate the
lesser for that portion of the gas vented or flared without approval which is
determined to have been avoidably lost.

A schematic facilities diagram as required by 43 CFR 3162.7-2, 3162.7-3 and
3162.7-4 shall be submitted to the appropriate District Office within 30 days
of installation or first production, whichever occurs first. All site security
regulations as specified in 43 CFR 3162.7 and Onshore Order No.3 shall be
adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks
will be effectively sealed in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-4.

Section 102(b)(3) of the Federal Oil and Gas Royalty Management Act of
1982, as implemented by the applicable provisions of the operating
regulations at Title 43 CFR 3162.4-1(c), requires that “not later than the 5t
business day after any well begins production on which royalty is due
anywhere on a lease site or allocated to a lease site, or resumes production in
the case of a well which has been off production for more than 90 days, the
operator shall notify the authorized officer by letter or sundry notice, Form
3160-3, or orally to be followed by a letter or sundry notice, of the date on
which such production has begun or resumed.”

If you fail to comply with this requirement in the manner and time allowed,
you shall be liable for a civil penalty of up to $10,000 per violation for each
day such violation continues, not to exceed a maximum of 20 days. See
Section 109 (3) of the Federal Oil and Gas Royalty Management Act of 1982
and the implementing regulations at Title 43 CFR 3162.4-1(b)(5)(i1).

. Drilling will commence on approximately June 30, 1996 to avoid wither
operations within the forest.

It is anticipated that the drilling of this well will take approximately 30 days.
No location will be constructed or moved, no well will be plugged, and no

drilling or workover equipment will be removed from a well to be placed in a
suspended status without prior approval of the AO. If operations are to be



suspended, prior approval of the AO will be obtained and notification given
before resumption of operations.

Immediate Report: Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents, or any other
unusual occurrences shall be promptly reported in accordance with the
requirements of NTL-3A or its revision.

If a replacement rig is contemplated for completion operations, a “Sundry
Notice” Form 3160-5 to that effect will be filed, for prior approval of the AO,
and all conditions of this approved plan are applicable during all operations
conducted with the replacement rig.

. Pursuant to Onshore Order No. 7, with the approval of the District Engineer,
produced water may be temporarily disposed of into unlined pits for a period
of up to 90 days. During the period so authorized, and application for
approval of the permanent disposal method, along with the required water
analysis and other information must be submitted to the District Engineer.

. No well abandonment operations will be commenced without the prior
approval of the AO. In the case of newly drilled dry holes or failures, and in
emergency situations, oral approval will be obtained from the SO> A
“Subsequent Report of Abandonment” Form 3160-5, will be filed with the AO
within 30 days following completion of the well for abandonment. This
report will indicate where plugs were placed and the current status of surface
restoration. Final abandonment will not be approved until the surface
reclamation work required by the approved APD or approved abandonment
notice has been completed to the satisfaction of the AO or his representative
or the appropriate Surface Managing Agency.



Surface Use Plan
Mid-Power Resource Corporation
Ridge Runner #1-30

Thirteen Point Surface Use Plan

1. Existing Roads

a.

The proposed well site is located approximately 15 miles south of Scofield,
Utah.

Directions to the location from Scofield, Utah are as follows:

From Scofield proceed south on Highway 96 for approximately 2.8 miles.
Turn west onto the Eccles Canyon Road (Highway 264) and proceed 4.1
miles. Turn left onto the Forest Service Road (#018) and proceed through a
gate and then in a southeasterly direction for approximately 8 miles. Turn
right onto the new access road and continue 0.1 miles to the location.

For location of access roads see Maps A & B.
Top map A is the vicinity map showing the access route from Scofield, Utah.

Topo map B shows the proposed access road to each well. It also shows
existing roads in the immediate area

Improvement to the existing Forest Service Road will require upgrading as
specified by the Forest Service.

All existing roads will be maintained and kept in good repair during all
drilling and completion operations associated with this well.

Existing roads and newly constructed roads on surface under the jurisdiction
of any Surface Managing Agency shall be maintained in accordance with the
standards of the SMA.

Road use permit # 0410-03-13 which expires June 112006 is currently being
renewed/extended. Maintenance of the access road will be conducted
according to conditions outlines in the referenced road use permit.



2. Planned Access Roads

a.

The last 7.1 miles of access road will be upgraded to accommodate rig traffic.
The road will have a subgrade of 14 feet with a running surface of 12 feet.
Four inches of gravel will be placed on portions of the access road.

Surface disturbance and vehicular travel will be limited to the approved
location and approved access route. Any additional area needed will be
approved in advance.

3. Location of Existing Wells Within a 1-Mile Radius of the Proposed Location

a.

b.

c.

f.

Water wells — non

Injection wells — none

Producing wells — none

Drilling wells — none

Shut-in wells — Ridge Runner #11-20 & #13-17 (See Location Map L-1)

For reference please see topo map B

4. Location of Tank Batteries and Production Facilities

All permanent structures (onsite for six months or longer) constructed or
installed (including pump jacks) will be painted a neutral color to blend with
the surrounding environment. The proposed color for this site is Juniper
Green unless otherwise stipulated by the Forest Services. Facilities required
to comply with the Occupational Safety and Health Act (OSHA) will be
excluded.

If storage facilities/tank batteries are constructed on this lease, the
facility/battery or the wellpad shall be surrounded by a containment dike or
sufficient capacity to contain at a minimum, the entire content of the largest
tank within the facility/battery, unless more stringent protective requirements
are deemed necessary by the authorized officer.

All loading lines will be placed inside the berm surrounding the tank battery

Gas meter runs for each well will be located within 500 feet of the wellhead.
The gas flowline will be buried or anchored down from the wellhead to the
meter and 500 feet downstream of the meter run or any production facilities.
Meter runs will be housed and/or fenced. All buried pipelines shall be



covered to a depth of 3ft except at road crossings where they shall be covered
to a depth of 4ft.

The oil and gas measurement facilities will be installed on the well location.
The oil and gas meters will be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries.
Tests for meter accuracy will be conducted monthly for the first three months
on new meter installations and at least quarterly thereafter. The AO will be
provided with a date and time for the initial meter calibration and all future
meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will be
submitted to the Vernal District Office. All meter measurement facilities will
conform with Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 4 for liquid hydrocarbons and
Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 5 for natural gas measurement.

A production facility diagram is attached showing placement of all proposed
production facilities. (See survey outline A-3)

Any necessary pits will be properly fenced to prevent any wildlife entry.

All site security guidelines identified in 43 CFR 3162.7 regulations will be
adhered to.

All access roads will be maintained as necessary to prevent erosion and
accommodate year-round traffic.

The road will be maintained in a safe useable condition.

The site will require periodic maintenance to ensure that drainages are kept
open and free of debris, ice, and snow, and that surfaces are properly treated
to reduce erosion, fugitive dust, and impacts to adjacent areas.

The area used to contain the proposed production facilities will be built using
native materials. If these materials are not acceptable, then other
arrangements will be made to acquire them from private sources. These
facilities will be constructed using bulldozers, graders, and workman crews to
construct and place the proposed facilities.

5. Location and Water Supply

b.

Any water to be used for the drilling of this well will be from the Price River
Water Improvement District (an adjudicated industrial water source) and
transported by a local trucking company (Nielson Construction).

No water wells are to be drilled.

6. Source of Construction Material

a.

Surface and subsoil materials in the immediate area will be utilized.



b. No construction materials are needed for drilling operations. In the event of
production, the small amount of gravel needed for facilities will be hauled in
by truck from a local gravel pit over existing access roads in the area. No
special access other than for drilling operations and pipeline construction is
needed.

¢. The use of materials under BLM jurisdiction will conform with 43 CFR
3610.2.3. Construction material will not be located on lease.

d. No construction materials will be removed from Federal land.
e. All access roads crossing BLM land is shown on topo map B.

7. Methods of Handling Waste Disposal

a. The reserve pit will be constructed so as not to leak, break, or allow discharge.
The reserve pit will be lined with a minimum 10mil plastic liner.

b. The reserve pit will be constructed of sufficient size and capacity for the
necessary fluids for drilling and to contain any runoff from the drill site. Pits
will not be constructed within intermittent or perennial stream channels.

c. No trash, scrap pipe, etc., that could puncture the liner will be disposed of in
the pit. Garbage and trash will be collected in a trash cage and its contents
hauled to a sanitary landfill. All wastes caused by the construction activities
shall be promptly removed and disposed of in a sanitary landfill or as directed
by the company representative.

d. The reserve pit will be constructed in undisturbed material and below the
natural ground level.

e. A minimum 2-foot freeboard will be maintained in the pit at all times during
the drilling operation and the pit will be fenced during drilling and completion
operations.

£ Burning will not be allowed. All trash will be contained in a trash cage and its
contents removed at the end of drilling operations and hauled to an approved
disposal sight.

g. After first production, produced waste water will be confined to a unlined pit
or storage tank for a period not to exceed ninety (90) days. During the 90-day
period, in accordance with Onshore Order No. 7, an application for approval
of a permanent disposal method and location, along with the required water
analysis, will be submitted for the AO’s approval. Failure to file an



application within the time allowed will be considered an incident of
noncompliance.

h. Dirill cuttings are to be contained and buried in the reserve pit.

i. Any salts and/or chemicals which are an integral part of the drilling system
will be disposed of in the same manner as the drilling fluid.

J-  Sewage will be placed in a portable chemical toilet or holding tank and
disposed of in accordance with state and county regulations.

k. The produced fluids (other than water) will be produced into a test tank until

such time as construction of production facilities is completed. Any spills of
oil, gas, salt water or other produced fluids will be cleaned up and removed.

8 .Ancillary Facilities

There are no airstrips, camps, or other facilities planned during the drilling of the
proposed well.

9. Well Site Layout

a. All cut and fill slopes will be such that stability can be maintained for the life
of the activity. The upper edges of all cut banks on the access roads and well
pads will be rounded. Cut and fill slopes will be constructed as follows:

Height of Slope Slope
0-5 feet 3:1
6-10 feet 2:1
Over 10 feet 1-1/2:1

b. All fills will be free from vegetative materials and will be compacted in lifts
no greater than 12 inches in thickness to a minimum of 90 percent Proctor dry
density sufficient to prevent excessive settlement.

c. The working surface of the drill site will be surfaced with crushed gravel to a
depth sufficient to support anticipated loads throughout the life of the well.
Usually a depth of 12 inches of gravel is anticipated.

d. A diversion ditch having the minimum dimensions of 3 feet horizontal to 1
foot vertical (3:1 ditch), will be constructed around the site to divert surface
waters from flowing onto the site. The ditch will be located at the base of the
cut slope and around the toe of the fill slopes (see Drawing No. 1 —-
Construction Requirements of Typical Well Sites). A straw dike will be
constructed in the ditch outflow to trap any sediment produced from the raw
slopes. A culvert will be necessary where the access road enters the site.



e. A berm will be constructed around the perimeter of the site to contain all
precipitation, spills, and other fluids from leaving the site. The berm will be a
minimum of 18 inches high, 12 inches wide at the top, and having 1-1/2:1 side
slopes. The site surface will be graded to drain to the reserve pit. The
drainage pattern to be constructed will be modified for each site, depending on
the site specific conditions.

f. The reserve pit will be located on the east side of the location.

g. The stockpiled topsoil (first six inches or maximum available) will be stored
along the perimeter of the location as shown on the location platt.

h. See Location Layout for orientation of rig, cross section of drill pad and cuts
and fills. (See attached Platt A-4) -

i. The location of mud tanks, reserve pit, trash cage, pipe racks, living facilities
and soil stockpiles will be shown on the Location Layout.

J.  All pits will be fenced to prevent wildlife entry.

k. The reserve pit fencing will be on three sides during drilling operations and on
the fourth side when the rig moves off the location. Pits will be fenced and
maintained until cleanup. Reclamation will be undertaken no later than the

fall of the year after all drilling activity has ceased.

10. Plans for Restoration of Surface

Dry Hole

a. Rehabilitation of the entire site will be required and will commence
immediately after the drilling is complete. The site will be restored as nearly
practical to its original condition. Cut and fill slopes will be reduced and
graded to conform to the adjacent terrain.

b. Drainages will be reestablished and temporary measures will be required to
prevent erosion to the site until vegetation is established.

c. Generally speaking, the standpipe for well identifications will be removed on
National Forest lands. A final determination will be made on a case-by-case
basis.

d. After final grading and before the replacement of topsoil, the entire surface of
the site shall be scarified to eliminate slippage surfaces and to promote root
penetration. Topsoil will then be spread over the site to achieve an



approximate uniform, stable thickness consistent with the established
contours.

A temporary fence will be constructed around the site until vegetation is
established. The fence will then be removed.

At such time as the well is plugged and abandoned, the operator shall submit a
subsequent report of abandonment.

Producing Location

Site reclamation for producing wells will be accomplished for portions of the
site not required for the continued operation of the well. All disturbed surface
will be treated to prevent erosion and to complement the esthetics of the area.
A new site plan will be required encompassing the facilities required for
operation and interim reclamation measures.

. Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area will be
cleared of all unused tubing, equipment, debris, materials, trash and junk not
required for production.

Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons on the pit shall be
removed in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-1.

. The plastic nylon reinforced liner shall be torn and perforated before
backfilling of the reserve pit.

At the end of drilling operations, drilling fluids will be hauled to an approve
disposal site. All polluting substances or contaminated materials, such as oil,
oil-saturated soil, and gravel, will be buried within a minimum of 2 feet of
clean soil as cover or be removed from the Forest.

Once the reserve pit is dry, the reserve pit and that portion of the location not
needed for production facilities/operations will be recontoured to the
approximate natural contours.

. The cut and fill slopes and all other disturbed areas not needed for the
production operation will be topsoiled and re-vegetated. The berm will be
removed and the site graded to drain.

. The site will be seeded and/or planted as prescribed by the Forest Service.
This prescription will be determined prior to site construction on a site
specific basis. Nutrients and soil amendments will be applied to the
redistributed surface soil later as necessary to meet the re-vegetation
requirements. Fall seeding will be completed after September, and prior to
prolonged ground frost.



i.  Annual or noxious weeds shall be controlled on all disturbed areas. Method
of control shall be by approved mechanical method or an Environmental
Protection Agency (EPA) registered herbicide. All herbicide application will
be in cooperation with Forest Service personel.

11. Surface Ownership

Access Roads — All roads are located within the Manti-La Sal National Forest.
Portions of the access road are located on private lands.

Well Pad — The well pad is located on lands managed by the Manti-La Sal
National Forest.

12. Other Information

a. A Class III cultural resource inventory will be completed prior to
disturbance by a qualified professional archaeologist.

b. The operator is responsible for informing all persons in the area who are
associated with this project that they will be subject to prosecution for
knowingly disturbing historic or archaeological sites, or for collecting
artifacts. If historic or archaeological materials are uncovered during
construction, the operator is to immediately stop work that might further
disturb such materials, and contact the authorized officer (AO). Within
five working days the AO will inform the operator to:

i.

ii.

iil.

whether the materials appear eligible for the National Register of
Historic Places;

the mitigation measures the operator will likely have to undertake
before the site can be used (assuming the site preservation is not
necessary); and

a time frame for the AO to complete and expedited review under
36 CFR 800.11 to confirm, through the State Historic Preservation
Officer, that the findings of the AO are correct and that mitigation
is appropriate. If the operator wishes, at any time, to relocate
activities to avoid the expense of mitigation and/or the delays
associated with this process, the AO will assume responsibility for
whatever recordation and stabilization of the exposed materials
may be required. Otherwise, the operator will be responsible for
mitigation costs. The AO will provide technical and procedural
guidelines for the conduct of mitigation. Upon verification from
the AO that required mitigation has been completed, the operator
will then be allowed to resume construction.



c. Less than 10,000 pounds of any chemical(s) from the EPA’s Consolidated
list of Chemicals Subject to Reporting Under Title III of the Superfund
Amendments and Reauthorization Act (SARA) 0f 1986, as defined in 40
CFR, would be used, produces, transported, stored, disposed, or associated
with the proposed action.

d. All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that
full compliance is made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil
and Gas Orders, the approved plan of operations, and any applicable
Notice to Lessees. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his
subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished the field
representative to insure compliance.

e. A complete copy of the approved APD shall be on location during
construction of the location and drilling activities.

f. There will be no deviation from the proposed drilling and/or workover
program without prior approval from the AO. Safe drilling and operating
practices must be observed. All wells, whether drilling, producing,
suspended, or abandoned will be identified in accordance with 43 CFR
3162.h.

. “Sundry Notice and Report on Wells” (Form 3160-5) will be filed for
approval for all changes of plans and other operations in accordance with
43 CFR 3162.3-2.

aQ

h. This permit will be valid for a period of one year from the date of
approval. An extension period may be granted, if requested, prior to the
expiration of the original approval period.

i. The operator or his contractor shall contact the U.S. Forest Service at 801-
637-2817 48 hours prior to construction activities.

13. Lessee’s or Operator’s Representative and Certification

Permit Matters

Marion Energy Inc./Mid-Power Resource Corp.
Keri Clarke

119 S. Tennessee Suite 200

McKinney, TX, 75069

(972)540-2967

Drilling & Completion Matters

Marion Energy Inc./Mid-Power Resource Corp.
2901 East 20" Street

Farmington, NM, 87402




Doug Endsley — V P Operations
(505)564-8005

Certification

I hereby certify that I, or Persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the
proposed drill site and access rout; that I am familiar with the conditions which
presently exist; that the statements made in this plan are, to the best of my
knowledge, true and correct; and, that the work associated with the operations
proposed herein will be performed by Marion Energy Inc. and it’s contractors and
subcontractors in conformity with the plan and the terms and conditions under
which it is approved.

This statement is subject to the provisions of 18.U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a
false statement.

St S e

Date Name -



e
'FORM APPROVED * W EI(E

Fom 3160-3
(February 2005) OMB No. 1004-0137
UNITED STATES Expires March 31, 2007
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. LeascSiflo. 11170 P 207
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT il :
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER 6 [findian, Alote or TribeName -+ -
la. Type of work: DRILL I:IREENTER 7 If Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.
Clear Creek Unit
8. Lease Name and Well No.
Ib. Type of Well: DOiI Well Gas Well DOthcr Single Zone DMultiple Zone Ridge Runner #1-30

. . 9. APT Well No. ]

Mid-Powe rosion (YW Ergvqu Ine. |43 - 1y5 « 2580

- 0] ‘7‘(5‘.'7201 n¢ 55€2 «F. 2B3b. Phone No. (includeirdl code) 10. Field and Pooi, or Exploratory
Brs-Yegas Nv-89H7 m«anj. K 5009 GOB83ISOF6 I I-5Y) - F Exploratory

11. Sec., T. R. M. or Blk.and Survey or Area

2. Name of Operator

3a. Address

4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*)

At surface 1719.25f¢ FWL 1502.88ft FSL /SW/4 Section 20 14S-TE
NESW20 148 7TE

At proposed prod. zone 700ft FEL 1095 FNL /NE/4 Section 30 14S-7E (Bottom Hole)

12. County or Parish 13. State

14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office*
Emery uT

Approx 5 miles South West of Clear Creek

15. Distance from proposed* Surface 1719.25ft 16. No. of acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit dedicated to this well
location to ncares}‘
roperty or lease line, t.
fAlSO fonearest drig, unit line, if any) Bottom Hole 1095t 2375.28 40

18. Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file

to nearest well, dnilling, completed,
applied for, on this lease, ft. Surface 20ft BH 2950’ 6,050 ft See attached Bond Document

21, Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22 Approximate date work will start* 23. Estimated duration
9815' GR 07/15/2006 30 Days

24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. I, must be attached to this form:

4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (sce

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor.
Item 20 above).

2 A Drilling Plan.

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the 5. Operator certification

SUPO must be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office). 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the
25. Signature Name (Printed Typed) Date: .

/ Benjamin Evans 07/14/2006
Title ”
Landman
Approved by (Signature) e \ il Name (Printed/Typed) . . Date
/000 Uil satheud ) X —~ I )
. »sl HOG
Tidle Assistant[-2Id Narager, Office Division of Resources
Division of BRasources foan Fiag Office

Application approval does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to

conduct operations thereon.
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached.

Title 18 US.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 US.C. Section 1212, make ita crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*(Instructions on page 2)
) - e latal h Al s
arnmiane ar prenay | ATTACHED
Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Oi, 225 and Mining RECEIVED

ey AUG 04 2006

DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING



Ridge Runner #1-30
Footage Calls

Surface: 1719.25ft FWL 1502.88ft FSL /SW/4 Section 20 14S-7E
Ferron Point of Penetration: 345ft FEL 700ft FNL /NE/4 Section 30 14S-7E

Terminus (Bottom Hole): 700ft FEL 1095 FNL /NE/4 Section 30 14S-7E

RECEIVED
AUG 0 4 2006
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Marion Energy, Inc.
Ridge Runner No. 1-30
Clear Creek Unit

Lease, Surface: UTU-02353
Bottom-hole: UTU-02353

Location, Surface: NE/SW Sec. 20, T14S, R7E
Bottom-hole: NE/NE Sec. 30, T14S8, R7E

(Located on the existing Ridge Runner #11-20 well pad with proposed wells #7-20 and #8-1 9)
Carbon County, Utah

A COMPLETE COPY OF THIS PERMIT SHALL BE KEPT ON LOCATION
from the beginning of site construction through well completion, and shall be available to
contractors to ensure compliance.

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

Approval of this application does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable
title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations
thereon.

Be advised that Marion Energy, Inc. is considered to be the operator of the above well and is
responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease for the operations conducted on the
leased lands.

Bond coverage for this well is provided by UTB000179 (Principal — Marion Energy, Inc.) via
surety consent as provided for in 43 CFR 3104.2.

This office will hold the aforementioned operator and bond liable until the provisions of
43 CFR 3106.7-2 continuing responsibility are met.

This permit will be valid for a period of one year from the date of approval. After permit
termination, a new application must be filed for approval.

All lease operations will be conducted in full compliance with applicable regulations

(43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas Orders, lease terms, notices to lessees, and the approved
plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors.

RECEIVED
AUG 0 4 2006
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A. DRILLING PROGRAM

1. The proposed 3M BOP system is adequate for anticipated conditions.
Installation, testing and operation of the system shall be in conformance with
Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2.

2. Concurrent approval from the State of Utah, Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
(DOGM) is required before conducting any surface disturbing activities.

3. Surface casing shall be cemented to surface.

4, The intermediate casing shall be cemented into place such that the top-of-cement

extends a minimum of 100 feet into the surface casing, leaving no annular space
exposed to open-hole above the intermediate casing shoe. The top-of-cement
shall be verified by a cement bond log (CBL), temperature survey or other
appropriate tool for determining top-of-cement, unless cement is circulated to
surface.

5. If logging reveals that the cementing objectives were not met, remedial cementing
will be required.

6. The requirements for air drilling, found in Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2, part
I, E (Special Drilling Operations), shall be followed. This section requires, at a
minimum, the use of the following equipment not mentioned in the application:

- Rotating Head

- Spark arresters

- Blooie line discharge 100 feet from wellbore
- Straight blooie line

- Deduster equipment

- Float valve above bit

- Automatic igniter on the blooie line

7. A directional survey shall be submitted within 30-days of reaching total depth of
the well.
RECEIVED:
AUG 0 4 2006
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B. SURFACE

1. The Forest must be notified 48 hours in advénce that heavy equipment will
- be moved onto National Forest System lands and that surface disturbing
activities will commence.

9. The Forest Service must be notified of any proposed alterations to the
plan of operations. Any changes to the existing plan are subject to
Forest Service review and approval, '

3. The licensee/permittee/lessee must comply with all the rules and
regulations of the Secretary of Agriculture set forth at Title 36, Chapter
1I, of the Code of Federal Regulations governing the use and management of
the National Forest System (NFS) when not inconsistent with the rights and
regulations must be complied with for (1) all use and occupancy of the NFS
prior to approval of a permit/operation plan by the Secretary of the
Interior, (2) uses of all existing improvements, such as Forest
Development Roads, within and outside the area licensed, permitted or
leased by the Secretary of the Interior, and (3) use and occupancy of the
NFS not authorized by a permit/operating plan approved by the Secretary of
the Interior. :

4. All merchantable timber removed or destroyed by construction or other
project related activities will be purchased by the operator at fair
market value. The Forest Service will conduct a timber cruise and
appraisal after the final clearing limits have been staked. Slash burnirg
will be conducted only at locations approved by the Forest Service under
authorization or a burning permit. Burning of garbage and debris 1is

prohibited.

5. All accidents or mishaps resulting in resource damage an.d/or serious
personal injury must be reported to the Forest Service, as soon as
possible. ’

6. Section cornmers, survey markers and claim corners in the project area must

be located and flagged by the operator prior to operations. The removal
or disturbance of identified markers must be approved by the' proper
authority. :

7. All surface-disturbing activities, including reclamation, must be
supervised by a qualified, responsible official or representative of the
designated operator who is aware of the terms and conditions of the
APD/SUPO and specifications in the approved plans.

8. 1In the event of a discovery, a revised surface-use plan must be submitted
to the Forest Service showing all mneeded production facilities.
Production facilities will be subject to further environmental analyses
and approval by the Forest Service.

9. Establishment of campsites on the pad or at other locations on Natiomal
Forest System lands by the operator or his contractors is subject to
Forest Service approval.

10, Fire suppression equipment must be available to all personnel working at
the project site., Equipment must include at least one hand tool per crev
member consisting of shovels and pulaskis and one properly rated fire
extinguisher per vehicle and/or internal combustion engine.

11. All gasoline, diesel, and. steam-powered equipment must be equipped with an

RECEIVED |
AUG 0 4 2006
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12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

- 17.

18.

19.

20.

effective spark arrester or muffler. Spark arresters must meet Forest
Service specifications discussed in the "General Purpose and Locomotive
(GP/L) Spark Arrester Guide, Volume 1, April, 1988"; and *Multi-position
small Engine (MSE) Spark Arrester Guide, April, 1g89". In addition, all
electrical equipment must be properly insulated to prevent sparks.

Anschutz will be held responsible for démage and suppression costs for
fires started as a result of operations. Fires must be reported to the
Forest Service as soon as possible.

The Forest Service reserves the right to suspend operations during pericds
of high fire potentia%.

The Memorandum of Understanding with the State of Utah Air Conservation
Committee will be implemented. This will assure project implementation
activities meet the State and Federal Air quality standards.

Reclamation recontouring and reseeding of disturbed areas will be
performed as soon as practicable (within the same drilling geason) .

Seeding will be performed using the certified seed mix listed below. The
seed mixture must meet or exceed the pure live seed standards of the Utah
Seed Law containing a maximum allowable weed content of less than 2
percent with no noxious weed species.

Species Pounds/Acre
Mountain Brome - Bromus carinatus 2
Intermediate Wheatgrass - Agropyron intermedium 2

Orchard Grass - Dactylis glomerata 2

Perennial Ryegrass - Lolium perenne 2

Timothy - Phleum pratense 2

Yoll 5 E—ETov Meld ffieinalid .

Cicer Milkvetch - Astragalue citer 1/4

TOTAL 10D4/4

Revegetation will be considered successful when 90% of the pre-disturbance
ground cover is re-established over the entire disturbed area. Adjacent
undisturbed areas will be used as a base for comparison. 0of the
vegetative ground cover, at least 90% must consist of seeded or other
desirable species. 90% ground cover must be maintained for three Yyears.
1f the desired ground cover is not established at the end of each 3 year
period, an analysis of why the area has not recovered will be performed by
the operator and additional treatment and seeding will be required based
on the results of the analysis.

An erosion and sediment control plan will be prepared as prescribed in the
Soil and Water conservation practices Handbook. During operaticns the
operator shall maintain seasonal erosion control structures.

All Topsoil must be stripped from areas to be disturbed and stogkpiled for
reclamation in such a way as to prevent soil loss and contamination.

Pollowing completion of the project, the pad and project ar?qEﬂEﬁélﬁﬁEt)

Stipulations, Page 2 rAlJG_ﬂ_‘Lzﬂﬂﬁ_—
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21.

22.

23.
24.

25.

26.

27.

28.

29.

30.

31.

32.

33.

recontoured to blend na:drally with the surrounding area. Gravel will be
salvaged and stockpiled in an area approved by the Forest Service.

The reserve pit must be dry before :t is backfilled and reclaimed.
Methods for drying the pit, other than natural evaporation, are subject to
prior Forest Service approval.

The pad area must be fenced (let-down fence) and the project road must be
adeguately closed off to prevent continued use until the required
reclamation standards are successfully achieved.

Livestock may be temporarily excluded from disturbed areas through fencing
or other appropriate measures in critical sections.

The operator is responsible for maintenance of reclamatjon facilities such
as fences, barricades and temporary drainage structures until the desired
reclaimed conditions are achieved.

The operator shall submit for approval, a maintenance plan for the site,
the project road and that portion of any Forest Development Road to be
used for project access. A road-use permit must be obtained from the
Forest Service authorizing commercial use of Forest Development Roads.
Requirements listed in the road-use permit must be followed. 1In the event
of a discovery, an updated maintenance plan will be required.

The pad and road designs must be consistent with Forest Service
specifications as outlined in the Region 4 0il and Gas Roading Guidelines
(Attachment 1) and the Manti-La Sal National Forest Oil and Gas Well Site
Guidelines (Attachment 2) and are subject to Forest Service approval. No
construction cperations may begin prior to approval. Any modifications to
approved plans are also subject to review and approval.

All vehicle traffic will stay on existing roads and new access routes.
Unauthorized off-road vehicular travel is prohibited.

A pre-construction meeting including the responsible company
representative(s), contractors, and the Forest Service must be conducted
at the project site prior to commencement of surface-disturbing
activities. The pad and road work must be construction-staked prior to
this meeting. Site-specific requirements will be discussed at this time.

The operator must acquire appropriate permission to use roads not
identified as Forest Development Roads.

The project engineer and surveyors must be certified by the State in which
they reside or maintain their business.

A gate must be constructed on the pad access roads near the intersection
with Forest Development Road 50018 to prevent public access to the pads.
The gate must be locked at -any time that the pad is unoccupied by company
personnel. The gate design must be approved by the Forest Service.

Surface aggregate will be designed to be stable and meet wear requirements
contained in Porest Service Specifications for Construction of Roads and
Minor Drainage Structures, section 703.06.

Drill pads will be designed toc prevent or diminigsh overland flow from
entering the site during precipitation events. Pad sites will be sloped

Stipulations, Page 3 : FQEEC:EEI\/EE[)
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4.

35.

36.

37.

38.

39.

40.

41.

42.

to drain all spills and on-site precipitation into the reserve pits. If
necessary, pits will be pumped ocut to reduce their content and insure that
overflow does not occur. Fluids will be disposed of off-Forest at a Utah

_State approved disposal site.

The operator must take reasonable precautions when setting surface casing.
to prevent excessive migration of cement in fracture systems that could
disrupt the flow and quality of water at springs in the vicinity of the
well. Measures such as use of high-viscosity cement and non-polluting
additives should be considered.

Water needed in support of operations must be properly and legally
obtained according to Utah State water laws. The location of diversion,
if on National Forest System lands, is subject to Forest Service approval.

Sanitary facilities are required on site at all times during operations.

The installation of facilities other than self-contained chemical toilets
is subject to State and Forest Service approval.

Unless otherwise specified in the Forest Service conditions for approval
the Surface-Use Plan of Operations, contaminated soils and gravel in the
project area and the contents of the reserve pit, including the liner
material, will be removed from the National Forest and disposed of at an
approved facility. Exceptions may be granted if the operater can
demonstrate non-toxicity through testing or isolation through
encapsulation.

Before construction, reconstruction, or operation activities can commence,
the operator must file a spill contingency plan with the Forest Service.
The plan must identify the potential for spills to occur, activities that
could result in spills, substances that could be spilled, identify
appropriate containment/cleanup actions, and identify equipment/materials
to be be maintained in vehicles and at the drilling pad to contain or
neutralize spilled materials. The plan must identify potentially affected
parties, required contacts, and time frames for cleanup in the event of a
spill. The plan must be consistent with the United States Environmental
Protection Agency Region VIII 0©0il and Hazardous Substances Regional
Contingency Plan. i
Anschutz will monitor water quality. Anschutz will develop and submit a
water monitoring plan to be approved by the Forest Service. The plan will
identify the monitoring objective(s), items to monitor, monitoring sites,
methodology, frequency and duration, analysis and reporting procedures,
projected costs, ‘and monitoring responsibility. Project implementation
will not be permitted until the monitoring plan is approved.

Sediment catchment structures will be added below critical construction
areas to reduce sedimentation.

Livestock may be temporarily excluded from disturbed areas through
let-down fencing or other appropriate measures in critical sections above
Burnout and James Canyons.

Warning signs will be installed at the entrance to road construction or
reconstruction projects, at the junction of Forest development roads and
work roads, .and near dispersed camp areas 1/4 mile from drilling
operations to alert hunters and other Forest users to the presence of

working equipment and crews. FREE(:EE‘\/EEI)
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43.

44.

4S.

46.

47.

48.
49.

50.

51.

S2.

53.

54.

55,

Drill rigs and heavy equipment shall NOT be transported in or out of the
Trough Springs Ridge area on FDR 50018 during Federal and State holiday
weekends. {(For example, equipment may not be mobilized on a typical
holiday weekend beginning noon on Friday through noon the following
Tuesday.) '

Drill rigs and heavy equipment shall NOT be transported in or out.of the
Trough Springs Ridge area on FDR 50018 during the opening days of the
general elk hunt (on or about September 28 through October 2) and deer
hunt (on or about October 14 through 17).

Road improvement and pad' development activities will not begin until
Monday, July 8th to avoid impacts to elk in their spring ranges.

Anschutz will construct a traffic barrier, obliterate, and reseed
nonaystem roads not needed for future management adjacent to the Trough
Springs Road. Approximate miles to be improved include nonsystem
ridgeline rocads leading into North and South Hughes Canyons (0.25 miles
each) and a loop road at the head of Valentine Canyon (0.5 miles). Forest
Service will supply and install sign posts to inform the public of road
closure.

Anschutz shall repair watershed contour furrows damaged during exploration
operations as approved by the Forest Service.

Drilling operations shall be coordinated with gfazing permittees.
Gates must be closed after entry unless otherwise specified.v

Anschutz will be held responsible for all damage to fences, cattleguards,
resource improvements, roads, and other structures on National Forest
System lands which result from their operations. The Forest Service must
be notified of damages as soon as possible. '

Harassment of livestock and wildlife is prohibited.

The operator will assure (certify) all drilling equipment, vehicles, and
all £ill materials, including road aggregate imported to National Forest
System lands for the purpose of construction, operation, and maintenance
of the roads and pads must be free of noxious weeds and seeds prior to
entering upon Forest Service lands. The operator will be held responsible
for control of noxious weed infestations within areas they disturb ie.
drill pads and roads.

Straw, hay, or .feed used on the Naticnal Forést's of Utah must be
certified weed-free by the State of Utah.

Surveys for new goshawk nesting territories will be conducted in areas of
suitable habitat the year prior to and during implementation. The
operator will be notified of the results of the surveys with any special
requirements for protecting them, if any are present.

If cultural or paleontological resources are found during implementation
of the project, operations will immediately cease at that location and the
District Ranger will be notified. Unauthorized excavation,. removal, or
damage of archaeological resources is subject to fines and other penalties

under authority of the Archaeclogical Resources Protection Act (ARPA) of

RECEIVED
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C. REQUIRED APPROVALS, REPORTS AND NOTIFICATIONS

Required verbal notifications are summarized in Table 1, attached.

Building Location- Notify the Forest Service, Ferron Ranger District Office at least 48-hours prior
to commencing construction of location.

Spud- Notify the BLM Price Field Office 24-hours prior to spud. Submit written notification
(Sundry Notice, Form 3160-5) to the BLM Moab Field Office within 24-hours after spud,
regardless of whether using a dry hole digger or big rig.

Daily Drilling Reports- Daily drilling reports that describe the progress and status of the well shall
be submitted to the BLM Moab Field Office on at least a weekly basis. This report may be in any
format customarily used by the operator.

Qil and Gas Operations Reports (OGORs)- Production from this well shall be reported to
Minerals Management Service (MMS) on a monthly basis.

Sundry Notices- Any modification to the proposed drilling program shall be submitted to the BLM
Moab Field Office on a Sundry Notice (Form 3160-5). Regulations at 43 CFR 3162.3-2 describe
which operations require prior approval, and which require notification.

Drilling Suspensions- Operations authorized by this permit shall not be suspended for more than
30 days without prior approval of the BLM Moab Field Office. All conditions of this approval shall
be applicable during any operations conducted with a replacement rig.

Undesirable Events- Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents, or any other unusual occurrences
shall be immediately reported to the BLM in accordance with requirements of NTL-3A.

Cultural Resources- If cultural resources are discovered during construction, immedia’tel'y notify
the Forest Service, Ferron Ranger District Office, and work that might disturb the cultural
resources shall cease.

First Production- A first production conference will be scheduled as soon as the productivity of
the well is apparent. This conference should be coordinated through the Forest Service, Ferron
Ranger District Office.

Notify the BLM Moab Field Office when the well is placed into production. Initial notification may
be verbal, but must be confirmed in writing within five business days. Please include the date
production started, the producing formation and production volumes.

Well Completion Report- Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, a Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log (Form 3160-4) shall be submitted to the BLM Moab
Field Office within thirty-days after completion of the well. Two copies of all logs, core
descriptions, core analyses, well test data, geologic summaries, sample description, and all

other surveys or data obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover, and/or completion
operations, will be filed with Form 3160-4. When requested, samples (cuttings and/or samples)
will be submitted to the BLM Moab Field Office. RECE|VED
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Venting/Flaring of Gas- Gas produced from this well may not be vented/flared beyond an initial,
authorized test period of 30 days or 50 MMcf, whichever first occurs, without the prior, written
approval of the BLM Moab Field Office. Should gas be vented or flared without approval beyond
the authorized test period, the well may be ordered to be shut-in until the gas can be captured or
until approval to continue the venting/flaring pursuant to NTL-4A is granted. Compensation shall
be due for gas that is vented/flared without approval.

Produced Water- An application for approval of a permanent disposal method and location will
be submitted to the BLM Moab Field Office for approval pursuant to Onshore Oil and Gas Order
No.7.

Off-Lease Measurement, Storage, Commingling- Prior approval must be obtained from the BLM
Moab Field Office for off-lease measurement, off-lease storage and/or commingling of
production prior to the sales measurement point. The term “commingling” describes both the
combining of production from different geologic zones and/or combining production from
different leases or agreement areas.

Plugging and Abandonment- If the well is a dry hole, plugging instructions must be obtained from
the BLM Moab Field Office prior to initiating plugging operations.

A "Subsequent Report of Abandonment” (Sundry Notice, Form 3160-5) will be filed with the BLM
Moab Field Office within thirty-days following completion of the well for abandonment. This
report will indicate where plugs were placed and the current status of surface restoration. Upon
completion of approved plugging, a regulation marker will be erected in accordance with 43 CFR
3162.6. Final abandonment will not be approved until the surface reclamation work required by
the approved APD or approved abandonment notice has been completed to the satisfaction of
the Forest Service, Ferron Ranger District Office.

TABLE 1
NOTIFICATIONS

Notify Tom Lloyd (435-636-3596) of the Forest Service, Ferron Ranger District; or
Walton Willis (435-636-3662) of the BLM Price Field Office for the following:

2 days prior to commencement of dirt work, construction and reclamation; (Lioyd)
1 day prior to spud; (Willis)

50 feet prior to reaching the surface casing setting depth; (Willis)

3 hours prior to testing BOP equipment. (Willis)

If the person at the above number cannot be reached, notify the BLM Moab Field Office at
435-259-2100.

Well abandonment operations require 24-hour advance notice and prior approval. In the case of
newly drilled dry holes, verbal approval can be obtained from:

Office: 435-259-2117 RECEIVED
Home: 435-259-2214 AUG 0 4 2006

Eric Jones, Petroleum Engineer

DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

6. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

Cloemeletsl— ((-6 ) 353

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below cumrent bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged welils, or to
drilt horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Clear Creek Unit

1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

/ .

oLweLL [J  GAsSWwELL OTHER Ridge Runner 1-30

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APINUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc. 4301530680
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT.
119 S. Tennessee iy McKinney state TX 7 75069 (972) 540-2967 Clear Creek Unit
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT sURFACE: 150" FSL, 1719' FWL county: Emery
#
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NESW 20 148 7E STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

[] Acwoize [] oeepen [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

[#] NoTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) [J Autercasing [] FrAcTuRrE TREAT [[] sIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [] casingRePaR [C] NEWCONSTRUCTION [] TeEMPORARILY ABANDON

[J cHanGE To PREVIOUS PLANS [] oPeraToR cHANGE [J tueNerepar
[[] crancE TuBING [[] PLucaND ABANDON [C] venToRFLARE

[C] suBSEQUENT REPORT [ cHaNGE WELL NAME [] eruesack [J warer DisposaL

(Submit Original Form Only)
[] CHANGE WELL STATUS [C] PRODUCTION (START/IRESUME) [[] WATER sHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

[[] commiNGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE /] omer: 1 Year APD
[] converTweLL TYPE [[] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Extension

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Marion Energy Inc. is requesting a one year extension of its APD for the Ridge Runner 1-30, APl Number 4301530680. We

are requesting this because of the availability of rigs.

by the

»
.

LY SENT TO OFERAIGE
AT - .o

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Scott JaCOby TITLE

Associate Landman

4/23/2007

DATE

SIGNATURE(—%' %

-/

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

RECEIVED
APR 2 4 2007
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(this form should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

API: 14301530680 !
Well Name: Ridge Runner 1-30
Location: NESW Sec 20 T14S R7E

Company Permit Issued to: Mid Power Resource Corporation
Date Original Permit Issued: 4/26/2006

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submitted in the previously
approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which shouid be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface
agreement been updated? YesCONo ]

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location? Yes[CIJNo ]

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the
permitting or operation of this proposed well? YesCINob&

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way, which could affect the proposed location? Yes[INo i1

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? YesCINoiJ

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
which will require a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation? YesCINok]

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? Yes ZINo[]

SO /7
< A W 4/23/2007

Signature / / Date

Title: Associate Landman

Representing:  marion Energy, Inc. RECEIVED
APR 2 % 2007

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING




STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5, LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
USU-U-02353

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not usa this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole deplh, reenter plugged wells, or 1o
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Clear Creek Federal Unit

1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

oLwelt [ GASWELL OTHER Ridge Runner #1-30
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. AP NUMBER:
Marion Energy, Inc. 4301530680
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
119 8. Tennessee rpy Meiinney siare VX 4y 75069 (972) 540-2967 Wiidcat
4. LOCATION OF WELI.
FooTaGes AT surFace: 1502.88' FSL 1719.25 FWL county: Carbon
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SW 20 14S 7E STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

[] acioze [} oeepen [] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

] NoTice oF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) [ Autercaswe [] FRACTURE TREAT [] sIDETRAGK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximale date work will start: ] crsinG repar [T] newconsTRUCTION [[] vemroraRiLY ABANDON

[] cHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [[] oPerator cHANGE [] rueiNc repair
[ chanceTuBING [[] PLUG AND ABANDON [ venToRFLARE

[(] sussEQUENT REPORT [C] cnance weLL Name [] pwesack [} water pisposaL

(Submit Qriginal Form Only)
[] cancEweLL STATUS [] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [7] water sHut-oFF
Date of work completion:

[[] cOMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [[] RecLamaTION OF WELL SITE 7] omer: Moving Drill Rig onto
[[] converTweLLTYPE [T] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Location

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc,
Marion Energy Inc. Will be moving a Drilling Rig onto the Ridge Runner #1-30 Pad Location at the earliest of Wednesday

August 1, 2007

RECEIVED
JUL 312007

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Scott Jacoby

TTLE

Associate Landman

713112007

DATE

SIGNATURE __ ‘T;’:th‘ 'j%,/or'[‘.?
/A

{This space for State use only)

(512000}

(See Instructions on Reverse Sids)



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIiL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

™5, LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER.
USU-U-02353

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

mmmmm&m&bbwlmw«mmmm%mmm&m.reermfplumedwalb,ub
drilt horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposais.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOT TEE OR TRIBE NAME:

177 GNiT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Clear Creek Unit

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

1. TYPEOF WELL :
owwerl [} casWeLlL [[]  OTHER Ridge Runner 1-30
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: S, AP| NUMBER:
Marion Energy, Inc. v '
=3 ADDRESS OF GPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 0. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
119'S. Tennessee iy MeKinney srare TX 2790689 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat
4. LOCATION OF WELL » -
rooTaces AT sureace: 1502.88ft FSL 1719.25f FWL county: Carbon
CTRAITR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SW 20 148 7TE STATE:

UTAH

1" CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION _ TYPE OF ACTION
[} acioze [[] oeeren [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
0 womice oF mrent
(Submit in Duplicate) [[] auercasns [[1 eracTure TREAT [ sioemrackTo REPARWELL

Approximate date work wil start [] wewconstrucTion
[] oreraTor cance

[3 ruucanp AsanDON

[ casme repar
[] cranceTorrevious pLaNs

[] cnanceTuBNG

A suvesscuenT RePorT [ crancewers name [ rwesack
(Submit Origiral Form Only)
D CHANGE WELL STATUS [[] Ppropuchon (STARTRESUME)
Dade of work complation:

D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE

[3 converrwew tvre [} recoMpLETE- DIFFERENT FORMATION

[[] TemPoRramiLY ABANDON
[ tusine repar

[ vaworrAare

[[] warer oisposaL

[[] warer snut-oFF

omver: Move in Pete Martin
“Briffing

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent detalls including dates, depths, volumes, efc.
Moved in Pete Martin Drilling and set and cemented 40’ of 20" conductor. This sundry will serve as spud notification on this well

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Doug, Endsley wme VP Operations

SIGNATURE m oare _B/3/2007
ot -
{This space for State use only)
RECEIVED
AUG 1 0 2007
(6/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING




DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION
Name of Company: MARION ENERGY, INC
Well Name: RIDGE RUNNER 1-30
Api No; | 43-015-30680 Lease Type: FEDERAL
Section_ 20 Township__14S Range_ 07E _ County EMERY
Drilling Contractor UNIT DRILLING RIG #__132
SPUDDED:
Date 09/11/07
Time
How DRY

Drilling will Commence:

Reported by R L TATMAN

Telephone #

Date 09/11/07 Signed CHD




STATE OF UTAH

FORM 6

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator. ~ Marion Energy Inc. Operator Account Number: N 2740
Address: 119 S. Tennessee, Ste. 200
city McKinney
state TX zip 75089 Phone Number: _(972) 540-2967
Well 1
APl Number Well Name QQ ( Sec | Twp | Rng County
4301530680 Ridge Runner #1-30 NESW| 20 148 7E Emery
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date
;/ 5 99999 % S50 9/11/2007 / 0/ 3/ / 67
Comments: F /() sb B . & /VES w 7/ 7
Well 2
APl Number Well Name QQ Sec | Twp | Rng County
4300731229 Kenilworth Railroad #1 SWD SWSE| 16 138 10E Carbon
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date
A 99999 /45 b 10/9/2007 10/21]p7
Comments: w / N 8’ 7_ 4 4
Well 3
API Number Well Name QQ Sec | Twp | Rng County
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date
Comments:
ACTION CODES:

A - Establish new entity for new well (single well anly)
B - Add new well to existing entity (group or unit weli)

- Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity

C
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity
E - Other (Explain in ‘comments’ section)

(5/2000%

Benjamin Evans

Nanje (Please Print) ¢ ;__,,, ~
e

Signature
Landman 10/31/2007
Title Date

RECEIVED
OCT 31 2007
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069 4% 0/5+ 2030
DAILY DRILLING REPORT 4SS 9 2D
| EASE NAME & WELL NO. [reo DATE T
Ridge Runner 1-30 Clear Creak September 11, 2007
RIG NAME AND NUMBER ' counTY {sTATE pays from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Emery Utah 0
[TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs  jcum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET@ Report No.
55" Conductor 55' RKB l 1
JACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Preparing to Skid Sub onto well R.L.Tatman / Shiloch Williams
JREMARKS ’ KB TO GL.
15
TIME LOG
FROM T0 | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 18:00 | 12.00 |Rig down sub and prepare to skid / Move out front yard Set up BHA for Inspection.
18:00 | 22:30 | 4.50 |Cut drilling line slip and cut 1500'0f drilling line, to move bad spot through
22:30 | 6:00 | 7.50 |Rig down /Hang BOP disconect electrical and water lines to skid sub.

[~ Total Hours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair | 0.00 | FUELUSED | 288  Gallons Boller Hours NA up
{Hrs. Mob./Demoby 24.00 Bbls. Water hauled last 24 hours in 0 Out{DOWN
[TOTAL DAYWORK Total H20 used on well & road Barrels JROTATE
| MUD RECORD ] MUD MATERIALS USED "BIT RECORD
|DEPTH INO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Poly Pius SIZE
WEIGHT Fed Seal Imrc
VIS AL Sterate  JTYPE
wm DAPP TFA
v Fed-Zan hET
{meT n K-608 SERIAL NO.
= F%E-PEW-E.., o Toemion
|ems SER-2 72007 Durage Joermi
ALK ‘ C-32% TOTAL FEET
Im DIV-OF-OL-GAS-S-MINING T
CAXE Cotton seed hulls  [T/B/G
o DAILY COST jwr. on BT
Ioare JPrEVIOUS COST |rem
%SOLIDS L JCUMULATIVE COST B [roP(fph)
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCREPTION LENGTH - FT  [pUuMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
Jmaxce Nat | Nat
jmoDEL 8p80 | 8P80
fsTROKE 8.50 { 850
| R —— c c T




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
JLEAsE NaE & WELL NO. Jrap DATE
Ridge Runner 1-30 Clear Creak September 12, 2007
JRIG NAME AND HUMBER counTY Jstare pays from spud
Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 0
ITOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs  fourn Rot. Hrs FOUTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
55' 20" Conductor 55' RKB 2
JACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Picking up Tools To Spud well. R.L.Tatman / Shiloh Williams
JREMARKS KB TO GL.
o s
TIME LOG
FROM 70 | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 14:30 | 8.50 ]Skid Sub and Derrick forward 20' on pad to 1-30 well
14:30 | 22:30 | 8.00 |Set in and rig up water tank and Dog house, Fuel tank, front yard and rearange shacks to fit location.
22:30 1:00 2.50 |Rig up, Pick up Kelly and swivel, string electric cords, weld Fiow line together.
1:00 2:30 | 1.50 |Rig Repairs / Fix Kelly Spinner.
2:30 3:30 1.00 |Rig up / Set in Pit side stairs.
3:30 6:00 2.50 |Set coliars on Rack and strap ID,0D, Fish neck./ Pich up | drill collar and run in hole and tag cement @52
Total Howrs | 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair | 1.50 FUEL USED | 200 Gallons Boiler Hours NA up
Hrs. Mob./Demobl 20.00 Bbls. Water hauled last 24 hours 460 In 0 Out]jDOWN
TOTAL DAYWQ_EH 2.50 Total H2O usedonwell&road | 480 Barreis ROTATE
MUD RECORD § MUD MATERIALS USED 1. BIT RECORD
IDEFTH INO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Poly Plus SIZE
WEIGHT Fed Seal jvra
VIS AL Sterate ITYPE
WL DAPP [TFA
feviye Fed-Zan DET
jmst K-600 JseriaL No,
[CA H_BGE"VEE Fed 744 JoEPTH OUT
leris P 2 7 2607 Duragel JoerTH N
ALK S 4 C-325 [TOTAL FEET
H nnLn, b O A OOk Max Gel JHRS
CAKE VU LGRS & VIINTNG Cotton seed hulls  [T/B/G
o Jpary cost jwr. onBIT
DAPP JprEVIOUS COST frem
%SOLIDS JCUMULATIVE COST ROP(fph)
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  JPUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
maxE Nat Nat
JmopeL 8rs0 | 8p80
!smoxi 8.50 | 850
» e c—— e £ £ e




Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
MAME 8 WELL NO. |new foare
Ri Runner 1-30 {Clear Creak September 13, 2007
RIG RAME AND NUMBER counTy Jsvare pays from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Emery Utah
ITOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs  Joum Rot. Hrs FOUTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
480' 12.5 { 12,5 425' 20" Conductor 55' RKB 3
JACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Drilling 17 1/2" hole with Air hammer. lR.L.Tatman / Shiloh Williams
JRemams KB TO GL.
Spudded at 16:30 on September 12, 2007 l 15
‘ TIME LOG
FROM TO | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 } 11:30 | 5.50 }wait on bearing assembly for Rotating head.
11:30 | 13:00 | 1.50 |Pick up Hammer bit and bearing assembly, make up assembly. install Rotating head.
13:00 | 15:00 | 2.00 |Drill cement from 38' to 50' Plug flowline.
15:00 | 16:30 | 1.50 {Cut flowline and clear out blockage then weld flowline back together.
16:30 19:30 | 3.00 |Drilling 17 1/2" hole from 50’ to 124' with Air hammer and 1200 c¢fm.
19:30 | 20:30 | 1.00 |Rig repair / Repack Swivel packing
20:30 6:00 | 9.50 {Drilling 17 1/2" hole from 124' to 480" with Air hammer and 1800 cfm.
— Total Hours | 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair | 1.00 FUEL USED | ? Gallons Boiler Hours ~ NA up
Hrs. Mob./Demob  0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 150 In 0 OutjDOWN
TOTAL DAYWO 23.00 Total HZO usedonwell&road | 610 Barrels JROTATE
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
, INO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 1
TIME . Poly Plus SIZE 17 1/2"
JweiGHT Fed Seal IMFG Hubco
VIS AL. Sterate TYPE Hammer
WL DAPP TFA
fevrye Fed-Zan DET open
fmeT K-600 SERIAL NO,
Jea BECFIVED Fed744___|DEPTHOUT
GELS . Duragel DEPTH IN 55'
ALK OEHZ/ 2007 c-325 froTaL reeT 480’
'EH - Max Gel JHRS 12.50
CAKE DIV.OF D_'PAS_&_M]NIN(; Cotton seed hulis }T/B/G
o DAILY COST jwr. onBIT 4-6K
{oarr JPrevious cosT Irem 35t0 50
9%SOLIDS JCUMULATIVE COST | JroP(fph) 384
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT {PUMP NO 1 2 DEPTH Inclinwtion / Azimuth
fmaxe Nat Nat
ImopeL 8P80 | 8P80
ISTROKE 850 | 8.50
[ A r e e




Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
L EASE NAME & WELL NO. T DATE
|Ridge Runner 1-30 Clear Creak September 14, 2007
JR1G RAME ARD NUMBER counTy Jstare pays from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Emery Utah 2
[TOTAL DEPFTH Rot. Hrs  Jcum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED 1AST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE ’ SET @ Repart No.
530’ 2 14.5 50' 13-3/8" 54.5# }-55 Surfa 435' RKB I 4
JACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME . REPORTED BY
Welding 13-3/8" Casing Collar Onto Stump To Cement Casing C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
REMARKS KB TO GL.
IRun 10-Jts STC 54.5# 1-55 13-3/8" Casing 435.73 Feet Is Shoe Depth From RKB 15
TIME L
FROM T0 | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:00 2.00 |Drill Actual/ 480'-530'
8:00 9:00 1.00 |Circulate Hole Clean/ Full Stroke Pipe
9:00 10:00 1.00 JTOOH To Run Surface Csg/ LD 1-Jt Of HWDP
10:00 11:00 | 1.00 |Break Hammmer Bit & Croww Over Off/ Load On Truck
11:00 | 12:30 | 1.50 {Unload Csg & Strap
12:3¢ | 14:00 | 1.50 |Rig Up Casers/ Safety Meeting Rig Personnel & Casing Crew
14:00 Csg Tongs Faited Makling Up Shoe/ Change Out Csg Tongs/ Run Csg To 200’ Fill Pipe/ Run Csg To 240"
Fill Pipe/ Tight Hole @ 280"/ Rig Up Circ. Swedge Pump On Casing While Working Through Tight Hole
23,00 9.00 2804427 Hole Starting To Siuff Off.
23:00 0:00 1.00 {Lay Down Jt Of Csg
0:00 1:00 1.00 [Rig Down Csg Crew
- 1:00 3:00 2.00 |Rig Up Cementers/ Safety Meeting Rig Personnel & Casing Crew
3:00 4:30 1.50 |Coilar Damaged On Casing/ Break Collar Off Csg Stump Unsafe To Pump On.
4:30 6:00 1.50 {Cut Coliar Off Of Csg Jt That Was Laid Down/ Cut Threads Off Csg Stump/ Weld Good Collar On Stump
" Total Hours | 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 1.00 FUELUSED | 698 Gallons Boiler Hours NA upP
{Hrs. Mob./Demob 0.00 Bbls. Water hauled last 24 hours 150 In 0 Out]DOWN
TOTAL DAYW 24.00 Total H20 used on well & road 610 Barrels |ROTATE
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
{oEPTH INO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 1
TIME Poly Plus ISI1ZE 17 1/2"
WEIGHT Fed Seal | Hubco
VIS AL Sterate TYPE Hammer
WL DAPP [TFA
| i/t Fed-Zan DET open
jmeT RECcEIvVER k600 Jseria No.
fca i aded Ay Fed 744 IoermH out
GELS 9 Duragel JoErH IN 55'
ALK *P—-Z—Z—ZQO, c-325 TOTAL FEET 530"
N N TN Max Gel §HRS 14.50
Fcnm it IE“:’ B M NING ™1 Cotion seed huts 1/B/G
jo JparLy cost WT. ON BIT 4-6K
|oare JPrEVIOUS COST Jrem 35 t0 50
%SOLIDS JcumuLATIVE cosT B Jrop(fph) 328
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  [PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
|maxe Nat Nat
ImMoDEL 8PS0 | 8P80
- !smox: 8.50 | 8.50




Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
Ridge Runner 1-30 Clear Creak September 15, 2007
RIG NAME AND NUMBER counvy Jsrare Joays from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Emery __ Uteh 3
ITOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs  Jcum Rot Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
530' 2 14.5 o' 113-3/8" 54.5# }-55 Surface 435' RKB l 5
IACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Test BOPE C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
'REIMRKS ’ KB TO GL.
Welder Had Problems Getting Well Head Welded l 15
TIME LOG
FROM 70 | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:30 0.50 |Rig Up Cementers Held Safety Meeting
6:30 Cmt 10-jts 435' STC 54.5# J-55 13-3/8" Csg W/ 560sks Class G-Cmt 1.15 yeild Sgal/sk H20 5bbl Cmt
0:00 7:30 1.00 ]Returned To Surface Bumped Plug @ 650psi Floats Held
7:30 9:00 1.50 jRig Down Cementers
9:00 13:00 | 4.00 JWOC/ Cut Off Rotating Head, Conductor Pipe, & 13-3/8" Csg
13:00 15:30 2,50 }Weld ON Well Head
15:30 16:30 { 1.00 {Let Weli Head Cool Offf Test Well Head Failed @700psi
16:30 18:00 1.50 JReweld Well Head/ Test Well Head Failed @ 400psi
18:00 19:00 1.00 |Test Upper & Lower Kelly Valve, FOSV Valve, inside BOP Valve, High 3000psi 10min Low 250psi 5min
19:00 Install Koomy Remote, Test Back To Pumps Demco Viave ON Stand Pipe Leaking/ Replace Demco On
0:00 22:30 3.50 |On Standpipe And Test Back To Pumps @ 2000psi
22:30 23.00 0.50 [Work On Blewie Lines & Flare Lines To Cement Burn Pod
23:00 2:15 3.25 }Pre-Heat & Weld On Well Head/ Test Well Head To 1700psi
2:15 3:00 0.75 }Prep & Lift Stack Review JSA
3:00 3:30 0.50 |Set Stack On Well Head
330 6:00 2.50 |Nipple Up BOP
— Total Hours | 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair | 0.00 | FUEL USED | 280  Gallons Boiler Hours NA up
Hrs. Mob./Demol 0.00 Bbls. Water hauled last 24 hours 1500 in 0 OutjDOWN
[TOTAL DAYW! 24.00 Total H2O usedonwelli & road | 1500 Barrels ROTATE
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
{DEPTH ., OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 2
TIME Poly Plus SIZE 12 1/4"
WEIGHT Fed Seal MrG Smith
VIS AL_ Sterate TYPE PDC
WL DAPP [TFA
lpvrve Fed-Zan DET
{mey i X-600 SERIAL NO.
fca Rﬂﬁtl VE Fed 744 Joermi out
leas M_ Duragel foepTH IN 530'
ALK / C325 TOTAL FEET
Max Gel fHRS 0.00
‘Pc:m BV-OF QL GAS T MINING Cotton seed hulls _[T/B/G
lc {pAlLY cosT Jwr. onNBIT
|oarr IPreViOus cosT |
%SOLIDS JCUMULATIVE COST JroP(fph)
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  {PUMP NO. i 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
Imaxe Nat Nat
jmopEL 8P80 | 8P80
jsrokE 850 | 8.50




Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
RAME & WELL NO. J T Joare
idge Runner 1-30 Clear Creak September 16, 2007
G RAME ARD BUMBER counTY |stare pays from spud
Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 4
ITOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs  jcum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
530 0 14.5 o' 13-3/8" STC 54.5# J-55 Surface 435' RKB 6
JACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Working On Flow Line C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
Jresasrs KBTO GL
15
TIME LOG
FROM TO | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 Test BOP/ Function Test BOP/ Set Test Plug/ {Test Pipe Rams, Inside Kill Line, Outside Kill Line,
9:30 350 |inside Manual HCR Valve, 5min 250psi/ 10min 3000psi} Test Annular Smin 250psi 10min 1500psi
9:30 13:30 | 4.00 |Set Test Plug/ {Test Blind Rams, Check Valve Smin 250psi 10min 3000psi}/ Test Casing 1500psi 30min
13:30 14:30 1.00 {Weld On Choke Line
14:30 | 16:00 | 1.50 |install Rotating Head/ Set Test Plug
16:00 Test Outer Manual HCR Valve 5min 250 psi 10min 3000ps¥/ Inner & Outer Choke Manifold Valves
17:30 1.50 |5min 250psi 10min 3000psi/ Puli Test Plug
17:30 | 6:00 | 12.50 |Working On Flow Line Had To Unbolt And Rebolt Seven Times To Cut & Fab
I TotalHours | 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair | 0.00 FUELUSED | 343 Gallons Boiler Hours NA uP
jHrs. Mob./Demoby  0.00 Bbls. Water hauled fast 24 hours 1500 In 0 OutjDOWN
TOTAL DAYW% 24.00 Total H20 used on well & road 1500 Barrels ROTATE |
e —————————— A —
MUD RECORD ] MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
IDEPTH INO. OF SACKS/LBS 'PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 2
TIME Poly Plus ISIZE 12 1/4"
WEIGHT Fed Seal IMFG Smith
VIS AL Sterate TYPE PDC
WL DAPP | LI
|pvrr Fed-Zan DET
jmer N P, K-600 SERIAL NO.
fca ngucliveD “Fed 744 JoermH out
GELS Duragel joerTH N 530'
ALK 5?'2'7'7007 C-325 TOTAL FEET
pH M MaxGel  IHRS 0.00
ta@ s L, GAS & MINING Cotton seed hulls ¥T/B/G
la Jpany cost jwr. onerT
loare Jprevious cost Jrem
%SOLIDS fcumuLATIVE COST | fROP(fph)
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT }PUMP NO 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
IMAKE Nat | Nat
mMoDEL 8P80 | 8P80
IsTROKE 8.50 | 8.50
| A e prape




Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE IAME & WELL NO. [reo foate
idge Runner 1-30 Clear Creak September 17, 20607
G NAME AMD RUMBER counTY |srare pays from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Emery Utah 5
ITOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs  Joumn Rok His FOOTAGE DRILLED  'JLAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET@ Repost No.
6200 | 2.5 17 S0’ 13-3/8" STC 54.5# J-55 Surface 435' RKB 7
JACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Drill Actual C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
Fm KB TO GL.
15
TIME LOG
FROM T0 | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 9:00 3.00 jWeld & Bold Flow Line Together/ Nipple Up Rotating Head, Kill Line, & Fill Up Line
14:00 | 14:00 | 5.00 }PU BHA & Directional Tools/ Scribe Dir. Tools
14:00 15:30 1.50 |LD 9-Jts HWDP
15:30 | 16:00 | 0.50 [install Rotating Head Rubber
16:00 | 16:30 | 0.50 {Kelly Up And Tag Cmt @ 367’
16:30 | 17:00 | 0.50 iRig Repair/ Replace Grease Cert In Kelly Swivel
17:00 | 17:30 | 0.50 |Driti Cmt 367'-389'/Drill Float Collar @ 389*-390% Drill Cmt 390'-424'
17:30 | 19:30 | 2.00 |Drili Plugged Bit TOOH/ Bit Plugged With Cmt
19:30 § 20:30 | 1.00 {Unplug Bit :
20:30 22:00 1.50 |THH
22:00 | 23:30 | 1.50 |Drill Cmtf 424'-435 Drilt Float Shoe 435-437'
23:30 | 0:00 | 0.50 |Drill Filv 437452
0:00 2:30 2.50 JRig Repair/Kelly Spinner Bearing Locked Up/ Take Off Motors & Tumn Buckles
2:30 3:30 1.00 |Drill Fillf452-530"
3:30 6:00 2.50 |Drill Actual/ 530'-620'
— Total Hours | 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT_
Hrs. Rig Repair | 3.00 | FUELUSED | 574  Galions Boiler Hours NA up 47
{Hrs. Mob./Demob} 0.00 Bbls. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 in 0 OutjDOWN 46
{TOTAL DAYWORK| 21.00 | TotalH20 usedonwell&road | 0O Barrels JROTATE 43
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
{pEPTH NO, OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. ' 2
TIME Poly Plus Jsize 12 1/4"
WEIGHT Fed Seal MrG Smith
VIS AL Sterate  JTYPE PDC
WL DAPP JIFA 1.33
v Fed-Zan DET 3-18/3-16
lmer - L K-600 SERIAL NO. MI616VSPX
fea NCLCIVED Fed 744 IDEPTH OUT 620'
GELS Duragel joer N 530'
ALK SEf 2 i 2007 C-325 [roTaL FEET 90
o Max Gel JHRS 2.50
E,:KE UV UF O, GAS & MINING Cotton seed hulis T/B/G
ja JpaiLy cost jwr. onBIT 5-8k
loaee JrreviOUS cosT Jrem 60/100
%SOLIDS JCUMULATIVE COST JRop(fph) 36.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  JPUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azkuuth
1 |12.25 PDC Bit 1.30 [mare Nat | Nat 465' 0.5/358.6
1 |NB Stablizer 7.20 jMopEL 8P80 | 8P8O
1 jMud Mr 25.12 !smoxﬁ 8.50 | 8.50




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORTY
LEASE MAME & WELL NO. fmew DATE
i Runner 1-30 Clear Creak September 18, 2007
G WAME AND WUMBER COUNTY lstare {pays from spud
Unit Driiling Corp. Rig 132 Emery Utah 6
[TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs  jcum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
1269 20 37 649’ 13-3/8" STC 54.5# J-55 Surface 435' RKB l 8
JACTIVITY ATV REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Drill Actual C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
w KB TO GL.
l 15
‘ TIME LOG
FROM TO | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 11:00 5.00 ]Drill Actual/ 620'-884'
11:30 | 11:30 | 0.50 [Survey/MWD Tool Not Sending Signal
11:30 15:00 3.50 {Drill Actual/ 884'-1067"
15:00 15:30 0.50 |Circulate & Condition Well Bore For TOOH For MWD Failure
15:30 16:00 | 0.50 |Rig Service
16:00 17:00 1.00 |TOOH For MWD Tool
17:00 { 18:00 | 1.00 {Pull MWD Tool/ 12 Missing Bo-Springs/ Found 10-Bo-Springs On Top Of Float IN Mud Mir.
18:00 19:30 1.50 |TiH
19:30 20:00 0.50 [Wash & Ream/ 1025'-1067*
20:00 22:30 2.50 Sliding/ 10687'-1082/ Rotating/ 10821 105'
22:30 23:00 0.50 |Switch Over To Aeriated Fiuid Due To Vibrations On MWD Tool
23:00 Sliding/ 1105'-1120Y7 Rotating/ 112011 30Y Sliding/ 1130-1145/ Rotating/ 1145'-1160'
2:00 3.00 Slidingl 1160'-1175" Rotating/ 1175-1178'
2:00 2:30 0.50 {Rig Repair/ Swap Rod Clamp Fell Off #1 Mud Pump/ #2 Mud Pump Clutch Will Not Engage
2:30 Rotating/ 1178'-1191/ Sliding/ 1191'-1206"/ Rotating/ 1203'-1222'/ Sliding/ 12221237/
6:00 3.50 |Rotating/ 1237'-1254" Sliding/ 1254'-1269'
"~ Total Hours | 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair | 0.50 FUEL USED | 1442 Gallons Boiler Hours NA up 83
JHrs. Mob./Demobl  0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 540 In 0 Out]DOWN 76
TOTAL M!!ﬂ 23.50 Total H20 used on well & road 0 Barrels ROTATE 79
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
IoePTH INO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 2
TIME Poly Plus SIZE 12 14"
WEIGHT Fed Seal jvrc Smith
VIS AL Sterate TYPE PDC
WA DAPP ITFA 1.33
[pvrve Fed-Zan DET 3-18/3-16
mer oY P K-600 NO. TX1676
fca EoTTveEpD Fed 744 tsozﬁom 1269'
leas - Duragel JoePTH N 530’
ALK F 2067 C-325 TOTAL FEET 739'
pH AV AF Max Gel jHrs 20.00
IEME i b“:' CGAS S MINING Cotton seed hulls [T/B/G
la Ipary cost fwr. onerT 8-12K
|paee JPrEvious cosT | 60/100
9%SOLIDS B JCUMULATIVE COST L {ROP(fph) 37.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT _ JPUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclnation / Azimuth
1 |12.25 PDC Bit 1.30 imaxe Nat Nat 465 0.5/358.6
1 NB Stablizer 7.20 |noon 8P80 8P80 558’ 0.5/19.2
1 [Mud Mr 25.12  |sTrokE 8.50 { 8.50 650" 0.5/45
1 Chark Gih 12 7% h ruen evre P31 %13 747 N SINA AN




Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
Fusi MAME & WELL NO. | T DATE
|Ridge Runner 1-30 Clear Creak September 19, 2007
JRiG e Ao mumpsr counry lsrare pays from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Emery ___ Utah 7
ITOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs  foum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET O Report No.
1900" | 21.5 | 58.5 631 13-3/8" STC 54.5# J-55 Surface 435' RKB 9
JACTIVITY AT REPORY TIME REPORTED BY
Drill Actual C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
fremaRxs KB TO GL
15
TIME LOG
ROM TO | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:30 | 0.50 ]Drill Actual/ 1269-1287"
6:30 7:00 0.50 |Survey
7:00 Drill Actuall Rotating/ 1287'-13187 Sliding/ 13181331/ Rotating/ 1331'-1350Y Sliding/ 1350'-1361'
Rotating/ 1361-13817 Sliding/ 1381-1393/ Rotating/ 1383-1413/ Sliding/ 1413-1425Y Rotating/ 14251444
12:00 | 5.00 |Sliding/ 1444'-1456 Rotating/ 1456-1476’
12:00 12:30 0.50 |Rig Service
12:30 | 13:30 | 1.00 |Driti Actual/ Sliding/ 1476'-1488" Rotating/ 1488-1507'
13:30 | 14:00 | 0.50 |}Survey
14:00 Drill Actual/ Sliding/ 1507*-1519" Rotating/ 1519'-1538" Sliding/ 15381550 Rotating/ 15501570
Sliding/ 1570-1582 Rotating/ 1582-16337 Sliding/ 1633-1848Y Rotating/ 164816647 Sliding/ 16841679
Rotating/ 1679'-1694Y Sliding/ 1694'-1709! Rotating/ 170917277 Sliding/ 17271740/ Rotating/ 17401759
0:30 | 10.50 |Sliding/1759-1771/Rotating1771-1790'
0:30 1:00 0.50 |Survey
1:00 5:00 | 4.00 |Drill Actual/ Sliding/ 1790-1805Y Rotating/ 1805™-1829" Sliding/ 1829'-1844" Rotating/ 1844'-1885
5:00 5:30 0.50 |Survey
5:30 6:00 | 0.50 |Drill Actual/ Sliding/ 1885'-1900'
— Yotal Hours | 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair | 0.00 | FUELUSED | 1759 Gallons | Boiler Hours NA uP 103
Hrs. Mob./Demobl 0.00 | Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 In 0 Out]DOWN 100
[TOTAL DAYW! 24.00 Total H2O usedonwell&road | 0O Barrels |ROTATE 88
‘ MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
lperi Ino. oF sacksiBs PRODUCT NAME | BIT NO. 2
TIME Poly Plus S17E 12 1/4"
WEIGHT Fed Seal MFG Smith
VIS AL Sterate  JTYPE PDC
wL DAPP TFA 1.33
{pvrve Fed-Zan bET 3-18/3-16
|mer _ K-600 SERIAL NO. TX1676
fea H 'CFI\IFQ Fed 744 Joermi out 1900'
GELS o Duragel JoEPTHIN 530'
ALK ] ? c-325 TOTAL FEET 1370°
- Max Gel jHrs 41.50
EKE UIV. OF QIL, GAS & MiNING Cokton seed hulls _[T/B/G
la Joany cost WT. ON BIT 12-18K
DAPP JPrEVIOUS COST | 60/100
9%SOLIDS JCUMULATIVE COST L IROP(fph) 33.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inchination / Aziewwth
1 ]12.25 PDC Bit 1.30 fmaxe Nat Nat 1223 4.7/213.1
1 |NB Stablizer 7.20 jmoorL 8p80 | 8P80 1316’ 6.9/222.3
1 [Mud Mtr 25.12  lSTROKE 8.50 | 8.50 1411 8.7/225.4
1 Chnrk Gk 1° IR 'lmem [~y | [ 1S <4l 11 1M K




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WAME & WELL NO. I DATE
idge Runner 1-30 Clear Creak September 20, 2007
G NAME AMD BUMBER counTY lsTate Joays from spud
Unit Drilli . Rig 132 Emery Utah 8
[TOTAL DEFTH Rot. Hrs  Jcum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED HAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ {Report No.
2460 22 78.5 560’ 13-3/8" STC 54.5# )-55 Surface 435' RKB 10
JACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Drill Actual C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
fremas KBTO GL
15
TIME LOG
FROM 70 | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 Drill Actual/ Rotating/ 1900'-1916" Sliding/ 1916-19317 Rotating/ 1931'-1947/ Sliding/ 1947-1959'
Rotating/ 1959-1879" Sliding/ 1979'-1994" Rotating/ 1994'-2010Y Sliding/ 201020257 Rotating/ 20252041
12:00 | 6.00 |Sliding/ 2041'-2056Y Rotating/ 2056'-2072 Sliding/ 2072'-2087'
12:00 | 12:30 | 0.50 |Survey
12:30 14:00 1.50 |Drill Actual/ Rotating/ 2087'-2105Y Sliding/ 2105'-21 107 Rotating/ 21102134’
14:00 | 14:30 | 0.50 |Rig Service
14:30 Drill Actual/ Rotating/ 213'-2220Y Sliding/ 2220'-2227'/ Rotating/ 2227'-2231/ Sliding/ 2231'-2246'
19:00 | 4.50 |Rotating/ 2246'-2260'
19:00 19:30 | 0.50 |Survey
1930 | 23:00 | 3.50 |Drill Actual/ Sliding/ 2260'-22757 Rotating/ 2275'-2291" Sliding/ 2291-2307"/ Rotating/ 2307-2354'
23:00 | 23:30 | 0.50 |Survey
23:30 Drill Actual/ Sliding/ 2354'-2357'/ Rotating/ 2357'-2386'/ Sliding/ 2386'-2400/ Rotating/ 2400-2417'
6:00 | 6.50 |Sliding/ 2417-2424'/ Rotating/ 2424'-2460"
Total Hours | 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS I STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair | 0.00 | FUELUSED | 1943 Gallons | Boiler Hours NA  JUP 110
rs. Mob./Demobj 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 90 In 0 OutjDOWN 90
TOTAL DAYW% 24.00 Total R20 usedonwell&road | 0O Barrels JROTATE 106
MUD RECORD ] MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
IoEP™H 2072 INO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 2
TIME 11:00 4 Poly Plus SIZE 12 1/4"
WEIGHT 8.4 Fed Seal IMFG Smith
VIS 28 1 AL. Sterate TYPE PDC
WL 230 DAPP TFA 1.33
lpvrve 7 Fed-Zan DET 3-18/3-16
|mer RE® EINVED K-600 ISERIAL NO TX1676
fca 20 it Fed 744 JoerTH OUT 2460'
GELS SEPI? 7 2007 Duragel IpepTH IN 530’
ALK 0.0/0.4 C-325 TOTAL FEET 1930’
7 DIV OF QIL1GAS & M,q‘\.n Max Gel JHRs 63.50
lPiM S g™ Sawdust T/B/G
la 1,200 Joary cost $8640.00  WT.ONBIT 12-18K
DAPP 6.0 {rrEVIOUS COST $0.00 |rem 60/100
%SOLIDS 0.00 JCUMULATIVE COST $8,640.00 ROP(fph) 304
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPYION LENGTH - FT  JPUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 |12.25 PDC Bit 1.30 Imare Nat Nat 1882' 19.20/222.40
1 NB Stablizer 7.20 IMODEL 8P80 8P80 2006' 22.90/220.60
1 [Mud My 25.12  ISTROKE 8.50 | 8.50 2101’ 25.00/217.80
1 Chnark Gish 12 7% h yurco cvrx £ K R IK I1AR 14 AND17 QN




Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
Ridge Runner 1-30 Clear Creak September 21, 2007
G NAME AND NUMBER counTY JsTare pays from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Emery Utah 9
fTOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs  jcum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
2671 | 12.5 93 211 13-3/8" STC 54.5# J-55 Surface 435' RKB 11
JACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
TIH C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
FEMARKS KB TO GL.
Outer Guage & Cutters Wore Out On Bit #2 Would Not Slide/ TOOH 15
TIME
FROM T0 | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:30 0.50 }Work On Fuel Lines For Air Package
6:30 Drill Actual/ Sliding/ 2460'-2465'/ Rotating/ 2465'-2481/ Sliding/ 2481'-2493/ Rotating/ 24932512
11:00 4.50 |Sliding/ 2512'-2521'/ Rotating/ 2521'-2543'
11:00 ] 11:30 | 0.50 {Survey
11:30 15:30 Drill Actual/ Sliding/ 2543-2559"/ Rotating/ 2559'-2675'/ Sliding/ 25752590/ Rotating/ 2590'-2606'
15:30 4.00 |Sliding/ 2606'-2620"/ Rotatingi2620'-2622'
15:30 16:30 1.00 Repair Leak in Flow Line
16:30 | 20:30 | 4.00 |Drill Actual/ Rotating/ 2622'-2637'Sliding/ 2637'-2657"/ Rotating/ 2657'-2669'/ Sliding/ 26692671’
20:30 | 21:30 | 1.00 |Circulate Btms. Up & Clean Well Bore
21:30 23:00 1.50 |TOOH For Bit #2
23:00 0:.00 1.00 |Rig Service
0:00 0:30 0.50 |Replace Kelly Spinners
0:30 1:00 0.50 |TOOH For Bit #2
1:00 4:30 Dir. Work/ LD MWD Tool/ Pony Monel/ Air Mtr/ 12-1/8" Stabilizer/ Break Bit/ PU Air Mud Mtr Would Not
4:30 3.50 1Break To Set At 2.12/ LD Air Mud Mtr/ PU Mud Mtr Set At 2.12/ MU Bit/ PU MWD/ Scribe
4:30 6:00 1.50 |TIH W/ Bit#3
 Total Hours | 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair | 050 | FUELUSED | 1100 Galions | Boiler Hours NA upP 110
{Hrs. Mob./Demobl 0.00 Bbls. Water hauled last 24 hours 80 In 0 Out]DOWN 90
TOTAL DAYWOE 23.50 Total H20 used on well & road s 0 Barrels JROTATE 106
MUD RE ] MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
EPTH 2671 INO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 2 3
[TIME 21:00 2 Poly Plus SIZE 12 1/4" 12 1/4"
JWEIGHT 8.4 Fed Seal MFG Smith Reed
VIS 28 1 AL. Sterate TYPE PDC
W 160 DAPP TFA 1.33 1.325
lpvive 3 Fed-Zan JET 3-18/3-16 3-24'S
[mer BEGEIVED K-600 SERIAL NO. TX1676 LD6458
fea 15 - Fed 744 JoepTH ouT 2671
GELS OEPIZ / 2007 Duragel _ |DEPTHIN 530’ 2671
0.0/0.25 C-325 TOTAL FEET 2141
H 7 DIV. OF Oli GAS & MINNG Max Gel HRS 78.50
CAKE Sawdust T/8/G 1-CT-3-CT-BC-2
o 1,400 DAILY COST $5,188.00  JWT. ONBIT 12-18K
lpare 9.0 JPrevious cost $8,64000  IRPM 60/100
9%SOLIDS 0.00 fcuMuLATIVE CoST $13,82800  [ROP(fph) 28.2
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  [PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 [12.25 PDC Bit 1.30 |maxe Nat Nat 2448' 29.5/214.10
1 Mud Mtr 27.59 IMona. 8P80 | 8P80 2541 30.9/213.5
1 {Shock Sub 13.75 !smox: 8.50 | 8.50




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
MAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
Runner 1-30 Clear Creak September 22, 2007
NAME AND NUMBER COUNTY ISTATE pays from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Emery Utah 10
AL DEPTH Rot. Hrs  joum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Repart No.
3039 | 14.5 | 107.5 368 13-3/8" STC 54.5# 3-55 Surface 435’ RKB l 12
AT REPORY TIME BY
Drill Actual C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
FEHARKS IKB TOGL.
Washed & Reamed Last 240' To Btm 15
TIME LOG
FROM 70 | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:00 2.00 [TiH W/ Bit #3/ Install Rotating Head Rubber & Break Down 5-jts
8:00 9:00 1.00 |Reaming/ 2058-2130°
9:00 10:00 | 1.00 [TiH W/ Bit #3/ 2529/ Tight Hole Lay Down 6-Jts
10:00 14:00 4.00 [Reaming/ 2529'-2671'
14:00 | 14:30 | 0.50 |Rig Service
14:30 Drill Actual/ Rotating/ 2671'-2695/ Stiding/ 2695'-27151 Rotating/ 2715'-2727"/ Sliding/ 2727'-274AT'
20:00 5.50 |Rotating/ 2747'-2758" Sliding/ 2758'-2777'/ Rotating/ 2777-2788/ Sliding/ 2788'-28097/ Rotating/ 2809'-2818'
20-00 20:30 0.50 }Survey
20:30 Drill Actual/ Sliding/ 2818'-2831' Rotating/ 2831'-2851 Sliding/ 2851'-2871'/ Rotating/ 2871'-2886'
1:30 5.00 {Sliding/ 2886'-2806'/ Rotating/ 2906"-2013'
1:30 2:00 0.50 |Survey
2:00 6:00 Drill Actual/ Rotating/ 291 3'-2918'/ Sliding/ 291 3-2938' Rotating/ 2938'-2950 Shding/ 2950-2970
6:00 4.00 |Rotating/ 2070-3039'
" Total Hours | 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS _ STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair | 0.00 | FUEL USED | 1100 Gallons Boiler Hours NA uP 110
rs. Mob./Demolf 0.00 Bbls. Water hauled last 24 hours 540 in 0 OutjDOWN 20
AL DAYW:! 24.00 Total H20 used on well & road 0 Barrels JROTATE 106
MUD RECORD 1 MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 2671 Jno. OF sacks/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 3
TIME 12:00 1 Poly Plus Is1ze 12 1/4"
JWEIGHT 8.4 Fed Seal Reed
VIS 28 AL. Sterate TYPE Insert
WL 40 DAPP TFA 1.325
Ipvrve 2 Fed-Zan bET 3-24'S
ImeT K-600 fsertaL No. LD6458
ka 10 Fed 744 JoEPTH OUT 3039’
feeis Durage! JoerTH IN 2671
jax 0.0/0.2 c-325 brotaL reeT 368’
I,Z:KE 7 2 waxcel __ |HRs 14.50 RECEIVED
Sawdust /B/G -
ke 1,200 Joawy cost $1,963.00  jwr.ONBIT 38-45K SEP 7 712007
APP 7.5 JPrevious cosT $13,828.00  IRPM 60/100
9SOLIDS 0.00 jcumuLaTIVE CosT $15,791.00  JROP(fph) 25.4 4 & MININ
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RE
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azdmuth
1 12.25 PDC Bit 1.30 Iaaxe Nat Nat 2634 32.50/213.30
1 fvod M 2759  jmooer 8P80 | 8PS0 2727 33.70/211.50
1 JShock Sub 13.75  |stroxe 8.50 | 8.50 2822 35.90/210.90
1 jPony NMDC 9.89 Juiner s1ze 625 | 625 2918’ 38.30/211.70
1 |Shck NMDC 31.10  fsrm 65




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tenn

essee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
Runner 1-30 Clear Creak September 23, 2007
G NAME AND NUMBER COUNTY Ism'e pays from spud
Unit Drilling corT Rig 132 Emery Utah 11
Al DEPTH Rot. Hrs  joum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Repart No.
3760' | 215 | 129 721" 13-3/8" STC 54.5# J-55 Surface 435' RKB l 13
AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Drill Actual C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
'&EHARIS KB TO GL.
3900+ Ft Of 9-5/8" 36# STC Csg Delivered To Loc. I 15
| TIME LOG
FROM TO | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:00 2.00 |Drill Actualf 3039'-3064"/ Sliding/ 3044'-3064"/ Rotating/ 3064'-3133"
8:00 8:30 0.50 {Survey
8:30 10:30 2.00 |Drilt Actual/ 3133-3227"
10:30 11:00 0.50 |}Rig Service
11:00 | 11:30 | 0.50 {Change Rotating Head Rubber
11:30 13:00 1.50 {Orill Actuall 3227'-3290°
13:00 | 13:30 | 0.50 {Survey
13:30 18:00 | 4.50 |Drill Actuall 3290'-3479"
18:00 | 18:30 | 0.50 [Survey
18:30 6:00 11.50 |Drill Actual/ Sliding/ 3479'-3494"/ Rotating/ 3494'-3604'/ Sliding/ 3604'-3624/ Rotating/ 3624'-3760'
[ Tokal Hours | 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS - STRING W1
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUELUSED | 1471 Gallons Boiler Hours NA up 110
Els. Mob./Demoby  0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 in 0__ OutiDOWN _ 90
AL DAYW! 24.00 Total H20 used on well & road 0 Barrels ROTATE 106
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
Joermh 3480 fno. oF sacksaBs PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 3
TIME 12:00 1 Poly Plus ISIZE 1214
[WEIGHT 8.3+ 2 Fed Seal MG Reed
s 27 AL Sterate  JTYPE Insert
m 160 DAPP TEA 1.325
Ievrer Fed-Zan hET 3-24'S
| 1 K-600 fseriaL no. LD6458
Iih;s 20 Fed 744 lpermi out 3760’
Duragel JoerTH IN 2671
ALx 0.0/0.15 cas__ frotareEr 1089° RECE{VED
7 8 Max Gel 36.00 _—m ]
e e sep-24 2007
ja 800 JoarLy cost $2,842.00  JwT.ONBIT 38-45K
DAPP 9.0 JPrevious cosT $15791.00  RPM 60/100 DIV.OF OIL, & MINII
%SOLIDS 0.00 JCUMULATIVE COST $18,633.00  JROP(fph) 30.3
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION nec%i‘ﬁ_"—
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT__IPUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azlmwith
1 12.25 PDC Bit 1.30 IMAKE Nat Nat 301¢' 40.10/212.90
1 [Mud mMir 27.59  [mopeL 8P80 | 8p80 3104' 41.20/213.40
1 |Shock Sub 13.75  jsTrRokE 8.50 | 8.50 3197 41.70/213.40
1 |Pony NMDC 9.89 Juiner s1ze 6.25 | 6.25 329¢° 41.00/212.70
1 [Shick NMDC 3110  lIspm 75 3386' 40.40/212.00
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Marion Energy inc.
Y- 05 30680

119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
NAME & WHLL NO. FIELD JOATE
Runner 1-30 Clear Creak September 24, 2007
NAME AND NUMBER LCoUNTY Jstare bays from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Emery __ Utah 12
AL DEPTH Rot. Hrs  Joum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
3925 8 137 165’ 13-3/8" STC 54.5# J-55 Surface 435' RKB I 14
AT REPORTY TIME [REPORTED BY
ing / Second run Richard L Tatman
KB TO GL.
_l__gggg_s_%e_dﬂat 3829’ / Drillers TD is 3925' Hole is l 15
E LOG
FROM TO | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:00 | 6.00 |Directional Drilling 12 1/2" Hole Drill and slide from 3760’ to 3885
12:00 | 12:30 | 0.50 |Lubricate rig
12:30 | 14:30 | 2.00 |Directional Drilling 12 172" Hole Drill and slide from 3885 to 3925'
14:30 | 15:30 | 1.00 [Circulate / pumping sweeps, Condition hole.
15:30 | 17:30 | 2.00 iShorttrp 15 stands
1730 | 20:30 | 3.00 |Circutate and condition Well pump LCM Sweeps to heal up hole.
20:30 | 22:30 | 2.00 {Pull outof hole.
22:30 0:00 1.50 }JLay down directional Tools.
0:00 2:00 2.00 {Clear off catwalk /Rig up Wireline crew.
2:00 Wireline logs: First Run = Compensated Density, Duel Induction, GL and Gamma, / Second Run= Calip,
6:00 4,00 |Gamma, Compensated Neutron. Loggers TD = 3829' Fluid level in hole at 334’ on first run
~Total Hours | 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS : TBOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair | 0.00 | FUEL USED 946  Gallons Boiler Hours NA upP
rs. Mob./Demoli 0.00 | Bbls. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 In 0__ OutiDOWN
AL DAYWO 24.00 Total H20 used on well & road 0 Barrels JROTATE
MUD RECORD 1 MUD MATERIALS USED BIT ﬁconn
JoEPTH 3882 INO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 3
TIME 12:00 2 Poly Plus 12 1/47
8.3+ Fed Seal Reed
VIS 27 AL. Sterate ITYPE Insert
L 120 DAPP TFA 1.325
fevrre Fed-Zan bET 3-24'S
Jver 1 K-600 JseriaL nO LD6458
fea 15 Fed 744 IoePTH oUT 3760
feis Duragel _ 'gm N 2671
ALK 0.0/0.15 C-325 AL FEET 1089'
7 Max Gel JHrs 36.00
Exi Sawdust T/B/G 4,8,bt.9,¢3,st,td
o 900 |parLy cost $3,643.00 . ON BIT 38-45K
6.0 Jprevious cosT $18/633.00  JRPM 60/100
96SOLIDS 0.00 ULATIVE COST $22,276.00  JROP(fph) 30.3
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT _ [PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimwith
1 [12.25 PDC Bit 1.30 Imaxe Nat Nat RE
1 |Mud Mir 2759  JmooeL 8P80 | 8P80
1 JShock Sub 13.75 __ |stroxe 8.50 | 8.50 7 12007
1 [Pony NMDC 9.89 LineR s12E 6.25 6.25
1 ISlck NMDC 31.10 | = 75 DIV. OF OfL, GAS & MINING
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United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO:

3160
(UT-922)
October 4, 2007
Memorandum
To: Assistant Field Office Manager Resources,
Moab Field Office
From: Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer

Subject: 2007 Plan of Development Clear Creek Unit
Carbon County, Utah.

Pursuant to email between Eric Jones, Moab Field office, and
Mickey Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land Management,
the wells surface and or bottom hole locations have been
modified. The following are the new locations (see our April 25,
2006 and July 18, 2006 memos for previous locations).

APl # WELL NAME LOCATION

43-015-30680 Ridge Runner 1-30 Sec 20 T14S RO7E 1514 FSL 1736 FWL
BHL Sec 30 T14S RO7E 1315 FNL 0172 FEL

43-015-30682 Ridge Runner 8-19 Sec 19 T14S RO7E 1513 FSL 1735 FWL
BHL Sec 19 T14S RO7E 2926 FSL 1292 FEL

This office has no objection to permitting the wells at this
time.

/s/ Michael L. Coulthard

bcc: File - Clear Creek Unit
Division of 0il Gas and Mining
Central Files
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron

MCoulthard:mc:10-4-07
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Marion Energy inc. 1 3-0k5 3580
119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
josre
’g;ar Creak October 2, 2007
— {stare {oays from spud
Emery Utah 20
L ASY CASING SIZE, WEICHT, GRADF SET & Repoet Mo,
g 5/8" STC 36# )-55 3934.1¢ RKB‘ 22
REPCHTES BY
C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
W KB TO G5
Tunuck Shale @ 6950'/ TD @ 7050°/ Wiper Trip is
T TIME LOG
FROM 1o | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
£:00 9:00 3.00 Dl Actual 88336828
3:00 9:30 0.50 jSunvey
930 14:45 5.25 (Dl Actual/ BOZR-F02T
14-45 15:15 § 050 [Suvey
1515 16:15 1.00 1Dl Actuall 70321-70507 1D & 7050
iai15 16:30 0.25 (Cuirc. For Wiper Trip
16:30 | 17:00 | 0.50 [Rig Senvice
1700 18:00 1.00 ;Circ. For Wiper Tripd Break Kelly & Blow Down With Air
1800 | 19:25 § 125 Tip Out Hole To Shoe
1825 2100 1.75 {Trip In Hole/ 6850710 2-4s DP
2100 2:30 5.50 {Pump 1800bbis Fluid W/ 2400CFM Before Estabishing Retumns
" 2:30 | 3:00 | 0.50 |wash & Ream 100 To Btm,
300 4:00 1.00 (Ciculale
400 4:30 0.50 iBreak OfF Kelly/ Blow Down Kelly With Air REGEH ‘EB
4:38 5:30 1.00 _{TOOHForlogs
530 6:00 .50 1P Kelly And Pump On Haole/ Break Off Kelly £ Blow Down With Air QGI ﬂ 9 2967
DIV ACAL -
PV UrUIL GAS & MINING
" Total Hours | J4.00_ FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS I “STRINGWT
Hrs. Rig Repair : 000 FUEL USED 1080800 Gallons Boiler Hours NA li.f? 187K
. Mob./Demot] 0.00 | Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 1800 0 OutjDOWN 114K
AL DR’ 24.00 Yotal HZO used onwell & road  {80C Barrels JROTATE 131K
D RE T MUD MATERIALS USED 8IT RECORD |
e Fisi] JNO. OF SACKSABS PRODUCT RAME BIT NO. 3
TIME 2200 g foly Plus | Svas & 3/4”
hanwr 8.4 Fedt Seal b Security
1S 28 o AL Steratz  JTYPE EBX5265R
w 480 CAPP TFA Open
ke 2 fod-7an T Open
bt £-600 BeuAL No, 10874724
ka i5 Fedt 744 Joetsi our 7050°
las Duragel berme 6303
bux 0.0/0.56 €325 FroTac sest 747"
Exz 7 Max Gei bixs 26.25
&5 Sawdust T/R/G
a 1,800 foanLY COST 412549500  dwr OMEIT 15/35
lowee 15 JpREvIoUS cosT $3209600 _ ferv 60/75
HS0LES TR JOUMULATIVE COST $4504500  JROP(Tph) 285
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA
0. i DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT__IPUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inciination / Azinadh
1 jBIT 1.00 Joanxe Nat Nat 6841' 43.90/207.90
1 IMOTOR 22.83 8P80 { 8PS0 6936 42.90/208.00
1 {PONY NMDC 10.02 {sTROKE 8.50 8.50 7008 41.90/208.30
1+ JSUCK NMDC 30.04 hoexrsize 625 | 6.25
1;  JGAP SUB 5.51 Jsem 85
1) . IRONY s osn | F— 274 00 1
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Marion Energy inc. L3 — 0l5 -30680
119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
Ridge Runner 1-30 Clear Creak October 3, 2007
JRIG NAME AND WUMBER ICOUNTY ]srm pays from spud
Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 21
{TOTAL DEPTM Rot. Hrs  Joum Rot Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Regort No.
7050' | 9.25 | 214.8 217" 9 5/8" STC 36# }-55 3934.11 RKB! 23
IACTIVITY AT REFORT TIME REPORTED BY
|Cut & Slip Drilling Line 120 C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
EMARKS KB TO GL.
.RHad To Move Csing To Get Acurate Strap/ Cleaned Threads/ Restack Csg On Pipe Racks [ 15
ME LOG
FROM TO | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:30 0.50 {Set Kelly Back & Biow Down With Air
6:30 10:15 | 3.75 |TOOH Forlogs
10:15 11:30 1.25 |Break Bit/ Lay Down Directional Tools
11:30 12:30 1.00 |Rig Up Loggers
12:30 | 17:00 | 4.50 jRun Density, Dual Induction, Gamma Ray, Nuetron Caliper Logs, Tagged @ 6963’
17:00 18:00 1.00 |jTiH With Bit #7
18:00 19:00 1.00 {TiH With Bit #7
19:00 4.00 9.00 |Strap Casing/ Take Off Thread Protecters/ Clean Threads/ Restack Casing On Pipe Racks
4:00 6:00 2.00 [Cut & Slip 120' Of Drilling Line
ULT Tt & ZUG/
DIV. OF OIL, GASE MINING |
— Total Hours | 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRINGWT |
Hrs. Rig Repair | 0.00 FUEL USED [1080/628 Galions Boiler Hours NA up 187K
Hrs. Mob./Demolf 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 1500 0  OutjDOWN 114K
[TOTAL DAYW 24.00 Total H20 used on well & road 1500 Barreis ROTATE 131K
I MUD MATERIALS USED
DEPTH 7050 INO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 6 7
TIME 10:00 9 Poly Pius ISIZE 8 3/4" 8 3/4"
WEIGHT 8.3+ 28 Fed Seal | aS Security Reed
VIS 28 7 AL. Sterate TYPE EBX526SR HP 53
WL 5 Pac-R TFA Open Open
fevive 1 Myacide DET Open Open
jmer 4 Huls ISERIAL NO. 10874724 DA3768
fca 20 25 Magma Fiber  JDEPTH OUT 7050'
GELS Duragel JoePTH v 6303 7050'
ALK 0.0/2.4 C-325 TOTAL FEET 747 0
E:xs 7 60 Ma Gei {HRS 26.25 0.00
Sawdust T/B/G 2-W-BT/2/3-E
a 2,600 Joaiy cost 4$4,389.00  JWT. ON BIT 15/35
| 5.0 JPrevious cosT $45,045.00  JRPM 60/75
9%6SOLIDS TR. JcUMULATIVE cosT $49,434.00  JROP(fph) 28.5
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  JPUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 |BIT 1.00 Jmaxe Nat Nat 6841' 43.90/207.90
4 l6"DC 12351  |mooeL 8p80 | 8PS0 6936' 42.90/208.00
9 HWDP 277.33 fsTROKE 8.50 8.50 7008 41.90/208.30
1 DARS HM) 29.74 !uumsxzz 6.25 | 6.25




Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
JLEASE MAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
|Ridge Runner 1-30 Clear Creak September 25, 2007
NAME AND NUMBER JCOUNTY lsrm pays from spud
anit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Emery Utah 13
ETALIBI‘H Rot. Hes  Joum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SErYe Report No.
3940' 1 138 15 13-3/8" STC 54.5# J-55 Surface 435' RKB I 15
JACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME BY
Running 9 5/8" casing IRichard L Tatman
rm KB TO GL.
Drilled 15' to fit the casing 15
TIME LOG
FROM 70 | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 9:30 | 3.50 |Wireline logs: Third Run = GL and Gamma, / Rig down loggers
9:30 14:00 | 4.50 |Trip in hole to 2353' / Break Circulation (good returns) / Trip in hole to 3792'
14:00 | 14:30 | 0.50 |Lubricate rig
14:30 | 16:00 | 1.50 |Circulate / Try to establish retumns with / Work pipe
16:00 Pull out of hole 13 stds / Break circulation @ 2750' / trip in 3 stands break circ. @ 3240/ trip in 5 stands
18:00 | 2.00 |break circulation @ 3502' good returns / Trip in to 3820' Break circulation (Good returns).
18:00 | 22:30 | 4.50 {Wash and ream fro 3820' to 3925'
22:30 | 23:30 | 1.00 ]Orill Conventional 12 1/4" hole from 3925’ to 3940’
23:30 Circulate hole clean work pipe up and down / Kelly back to pull out of hole / pipe unloading / kelly up Kill
1:30 2.00 |Pipe with 1500 stk / set Kelly back blow down kelly and stand pipe.
1:30 4:00 | 2.50 {Pull out of hole for casing.
4:00 5:00 | 1.00 [Rigup casing crew /5 min safety meeting with casing and iaydown crew.
5:00 6:00 1.00 |Make up shoe and float / Run in hole with 9 5/8" casing / floats open (differential fill)
Total Hours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS | STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair | 0.00 | FUELUSED | 1160 Gallons Boiler Hours NA jup
Mob./Demol] 0.00 | Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 190 In 0 Out|DOWN
AL DAYW 24.00 Total H20 used on well & road 0 Barrels ROTATE
MUD RECORD ] MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
loePH 3882 InO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 4
TIME 12:00 Poly Plus SIZE 12 1/4°
WEIGHT 8.3+ Fed Seal JMFG Reed
VIS 27 AL. Sterate [TYPE Rerun
L DAPP TFA
[pvree wED Fed-zan __ DET Open
MBT [ al= A= Nl K-600 Jseriac No.
cA 15 9 Fed 744 JoerH ouT 3940
feais ) Durage! Joerrv v 3925
jaux 0.0/0.15 e €325 TOTAL FEET 15
lgls z noy OF BiL, GAS & WP MaxGel _ |HRS 1.00
bl (Il Sawdust __ T/B/G
o 900 JDALLY cosT Jwr. oN BIT 38-45K
6.0 Iprevious cost $22,276.00  IRPM 70
9% SOLIDS 0.00 JCUMULATIVE cOST $22,276.00  JROP(fph) 15.0 ‘
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  JPUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
| Nat Nat
ImooeL 8p80 | 8PS0
jsTroxE 850 | 8.50
JLiner size 625 | 6.25
fspm




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE MAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
Ridge Runner 1-30 Clear Creak September 26, 2007
RAME AND NUMBER COUNTY ISTKTE loays from spud
Enit Drilling G 132 Emery Utah 14
lTGTALBS’ﬂ! Rot. Hrs  foum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ No.
3940 0 138 0 9 5/8" STC 36# J-55 3934.11' R!(Brzqm 16
IACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED 8Y
Trip in hole to drill out. Richard L Tatman
pm KB TO GL.
Bumped Plug @ 01:30 with 350 psi over FCP of 550 psi @ 3 Bpm l 15
TIME LOG
FROM 10 HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:00 § 6.00 {Runing 9 5/8" casing from Surface to 3900' tag up tag up on soft fil with 20,000 (set down wt)
12:00 | 14:00 | 2.00 [Rig up circulating swedge, and fill pipe, break circulation (no returns with 320 gpm) work pipe
14:00 | 15:00 | 1.00 IMake up Landing mandrel and landing joint / Wash down casing From 3900 to 3934’
15:00 { 18:00 { 3.00 |Circulate casing with no returns / rig down casers, Rig up cementers,
18:00 19:00 1.00 }Big 4 Cement truck cemented up on last job, unabie to do the job with this truck / Call for new truck.
19:00 | 23:00 | 4.00 |Circulate Casing siowly and wait on Pump truck./ Rig up pump truck / 5 min. Prejob safety meeting
23:00 1:30 2.50 |Pump Cement and displace with Pit water.(300 bbls.) cement as per below
1:30 2:00 | 0.50 jRig down Cementers.
2:00 Break out landing joint, change out elevators pick up 1 jt DP and set secondary pack off ring and test to
4:00 2.00 11500 PSI For 15 min.
4:00 6:00 2.00 Pick up Directional tools and Scribe
Shoe set at 3934.11' RKB / Float set at 3890.61' RKB
Cement Specifications: Lead Slurty: 500sx with 16% gel, 3% salt, 3 #/sx GR3, 1/4 sx flocele, 10#/sx
Gilsonite @ 11 ppg with a yeild of 3.82
Tail slurry - 450 sx 50/50 poz10% salt Bwow, 1/4 #/sx flocele @ 14.52 ppg with a yeid of 1.31
Pumped 800 bbis ahead with some returns, no returns during job Bumped plug with 300 psi over circulating |
pressure of 550 psi. Plug down at : 01:30
[ Total Hours | 24.00 — FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRINGWT |
Hrs. Rig Repair | 0.00 FUEL USED | 336 Galions Boiler Hours NA up
Hrs. Mob./Demol 0.00 | Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 1080 in 0 Out|DOWN
[TOTAL DAYW! 24.00 Total H20 used on well & road 0 Barrels JROTATE
T RUD MATERIALS USED BIT REGORD |
loEPTH 3882 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 5 RR
TIME 12:00 Poly Plus Jsize 8 3/4
WEIGHT 8.3+ Fed Seal | Smith
27 AL. Sterate TYPE M 516LKHPX
W1 DAPP [TFA 1.63
leviee -~ A/ Fed-Zan pET 3x20/2x18/2x13
 — REGECvVEY xe00 __ fsermaLwo. IW3042
fca 15 Fed 744 JoepTH ouT
leers ﬁﬁ%’ Duragel joePTH N 3940’
Jax 0.0/0.15 O c-325 TOTAL FEET 2239°
%E 7 A OWL GAS GV Max Gel IHRS 54.50
Sawdust T/8/G
cL 900 IDALLY COST AWT. ON BIT
Iparp 6.0 JPrevious cosT $22,276.00  IRPM
%SOLIDS 0.00 JCUMULATIVE COST $22,276.00  JROP(fph)
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT__ |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 |8t 1.00 Jsaxe Nat Nat
1 |MOTOR 27.75 _ |mopeL 8P80 | 8P80
1 {PONY NMDC 1002 |stroxe 850 | 850
1 |SLICKN 30.04 !me SIZE 6.25 | 6.25




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
MAME & WELL NO, FIELD DATE
Runner 1-30 Clear Creak September 27, 2007
NAME AND NUMBER counTy Jstate oays from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Emery Utah 15
AL DEPTH Rot Hrs  foum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED L AST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
4213 55 {1435 273’ 9 5/8" STC 36# )-55 3934.11" RKB! 17
AT REFORT TIME REPORTED BY
Cleaning tanks unplugging Bit and Collars. Richard L Tatman
I;!m KB TO GL.
15
TIME LOG
FROM T0 | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:30 2.50 {Trip in hole to 3810 / Pick up Kelly
8:30 | 11:00 | 2.50 |Break circutation and wash down to plug top unload casing with 1200 cfm
11:00 | 12:30 | 1.50 |Make up Landing mandrel and landing joint / Wash down casing From 3900 to 3934’
12:30 § 13:00 | 0.50 {Lubricate rig
13:00 | 13:30 } 0.50 |[Drili Shoe tract
13:30 | 19:00 | 5.50 [Directional Driling From 3940 to 4212'
19:00 | 20:00 | 1.00 ]Circulate Work pipe Hole not cleaning due to Pump malfunction.
20:00 | 23:00 | 3.00 }Rig repair/work on mud Pumps / Fould pieces of rubber and plastic from float ent / plug bit
23:00 2:30 3.50 {Pull out of hole / kelly up at shoe and try to unplug bit / pull out to Directional tools / laydown plugged DC
2:30 6:00 3.50 |Flush out Plugged diill collard and directional too/Dump and clean mud tanks (113’ of plugged BHA)
ECEIV/VEDND
TIE\JL.T VL.LJ
0CT-1-9-2007
L
DiY-OF OIS GAS A MINING
Total Hours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair | 10.00 | FUEL USED | Gallons Boiler Hours NA upP 112,000
Hrs. Mob./Demoly 0.00 | Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 1080 In 0 OutjDOWN 91,000
[TOTAL DAYW 14.00 Total H20 used on well & road 0 Barrels ROTATE 104,000
MUD RECORD T MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RE
loermh 4153 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 5 RR
TIME 17:00 Poly Plus | 51743 8 3/4
WEIGHT 8.5 Fed Seal MFG Smith
VIS 28 AL Sterate ITYPE M 516LKHPX
T DAPP TFA 1.83
v Fed-Zan BET 3x20/2x18/2x13
bt X-600 SERIAL NO. w3042
ka 140 Fed 744 JoepTH OUT 4213
feais Duragel Joermi v 3940
fax 2/1.8 c-325 TOTAL FEET 273’
B&z 9 Max Gel Iirs 5.50
Sawdust T/B/G
| 1,600 Joany cost jwr.on eI 5-15
loare 1.0 Jprevious cost $22,276.00  [RPM 75/65
%SOLIDS 0.00 JcumMuLATIVE cosT $22,276.00  JROP(fph) 49.6
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
#0. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT _ [PUMP NO 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 |sIT 1.00 Imaxe Nat Nat
1 |MOTOR 27.75 _ lmooeL 8P30 | 8p80
1 {PONY NMDC 10.02 JsTROKE 8.50 8.50
1 [SLICK NMDC 30.04 !unsn SIZE 6.25 | 6.25




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
HAME & WELL HO. FELD DATE
Runner 1-30 Clear Creak September 28, 2007
RAME AND NUMBER COUNTY Ism-s [vays from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Emery Utah 16
l}dﬂtm Rot Hrs  }asn Rot. Hre FOUTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET® Report Mo,
4768 | 13.5 | 157 556' 9 5/8" STC 36# J-55 3934.11" RKBI 19
JACTIVITY AT REFORT TIME REPORTED BY
Directional Drilling @ 4768’ Richard L. Tatman
freanss KB TO GL.
Drilling / rotating 70' Then 20’ corrective slide every 90' l 15
‘ TIME LOG
FROM 10 HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 9:30 3.50 |Lay down tools and clean out plugged directional tools and pick up directional toals and scrib / Trip in hole
9:30 10:00 | 0.50 ]Kelly up test motor and make sure pumps are running right
10:00 | 11:00 | 1.00 jiubricate rig / inspect Drum and remove line guide.
11:00 | 13:00 | 2.00 |Tripin hole to 4150°
13:00 | 13:30 | 0.50 linstal rotating head
13:30 | 14:00 | 0.50 }Lay down 1Jt and wash to bottom
14:00 { 15:30 | 150 [Rig repairs /work on # 1 pump motor.
15:30 16:30 1.00 [Circulate Unload hole with 1200 cfm
16:30 | 6:00 | 13.50 |Directional Drilling 8 3/4" From 4212’ to 4768" with 1800 cfm then 2400 cfm 20" corrective slides every 70'
RECEIVED
_0CT-1.0.2007
DIV-OF-OH-GAS-S-MINING
™~ Total Hours | 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS | m—
Hrs. Rig Repair | 9.50 | FUEL USED | 7047344 Gallons Boiler Hours NA jup 137,000
Mob./Demoly 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 in 0 Out]DOWN 97,000
AL DAYW! 14.50 Total H20 used on well & road 0 Barrels JROTATE 127,000
T MUD MATERIALS USED BITRECORD |
loerm 4153 Jno. oF sackses PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 5 RR
ITIME 17:00 Poly Plus | 743 8 3/4
8.5 Fed Seal | Smith
b 28 AL Sterate _[TYPE M 516LKHPX
i DAPP FA 1.63
leere Fed-Zan GET 3x20/2x18/2x13
b K-600 [SERTAL NO. w3042
ka 140 Fed 744 loerTv out 4768’
leas Duragel N 3940’
2/1.8 c-325 [TOTAL FEET 828
9 Max Gel JHRS 19.00
Sawdust T/B/G
oL 1,600 Y COST Jwr. onBIT 5-15
loase 1.0 {PrEVIOUS COST $22,276.00 _ JRPM 75/65
9%6SOLIDS 0.00 JCUMULATIVE cosT $22,276.00  JROP(fph) 43.6
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  [PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 |sIT 1.00 Jaxe Nat Nat 4006' 33.2/213.4
1 |MOTOR 27.75 __ lmopeL 830 | 8P80 4099' 34.30 / 214.4
1 {PONY NMDC 10.02 {sTROKE 8.50 | 850 4192 354/ 216.4
1 SLICK NMDC 30.04 !uuatsma 6.25 6.25 4285’ 37.20/ 216.3




Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
Runner 1-30 Clear Creak September 29, 2007 |
NAME AND NUMBER CounTY fstare vays from spud
Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 17
'TOTAI.DB'I’H Rot Hrs  {aum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LASY CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ ‘mnuu.
5897° | 23.5 | 180.5 1129 9 5/8" STC 36# J-55 3934.11' RKB 19
JACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Directional Drilling @ 5897’ IRichard L Tatman
Remanscs KB TO GL-
Drilling / rotating 70' Then 20’ corrective slide every 90' l 15
‘ E LOG
FROM T0 | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 15:00 | 9.00 |Directional Drilling 8 3/4" From 4768 to 5205' with 2400 cfm 20’ corrective slides every 70’
15:00 | 15:30 | 0.50 jLubricate rig
15:30 6:00 | 14.50 IDirectional Driling 8 3/4" From 5205' to 5897 with 2400 cfm 20’ corrective slides every 70'
RECEINVENR
st T VL L)
0CT-1-g-2097
7
DIV O AL e
T OO GRS T MINING
— Total Hours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING
Hrs. Rig Repair | 0.00 | FUEL USED | 760/540 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UupP 140,000
Hrs. Mob./Demoly 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 630 in 0 OutjDOWN 100,000
[TOTAL DAYW 24.00 Total H20 used on well & road 0 Barrels ROTATE 118,000
] MUD MATERIALS USED
JoErTH 4829' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 5 RR
TIME 7:00 2 Poly Plus | 1743 8 3/4
WEIGHT 8.4 Fed Seal | Smith
VIS 28 AL. Sterate TYPE M 516LKHPX
WL 160 DAPP ITFA 1.63
levrve Fed-Zan DET _ 3x202x18/2x13
vsr K-600 ISERIAL NO. w3042
fea 20 Fed 744 JoerH out 5897
lears Duragel N 3940’
fax .0/1.3 C-325 TOTAL FEET 1957
k:xz 7 Max Gel Jirs 42.50
Sawdust T/B/G
ke 1,500 Joany cost 4431200  JWT.ONBIT 10-20
Ipare 4.0 lprevious cost $22,276.00  JrRPM 65/85
%SOLIDS 0.00 JcuMuLATIVE COST $26,588.00  [ROP(fph) 46.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT __[PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 BT 1.00 Jmaxe Nat Nat 4753' 42.8/215.7
1 |MOTOR 2330  mopa 8p80 | 8P80 4848’ 43.8 / 214.9
1 |PONY NMDC 10.02 IsTROKE 850 | 850 4941 43.2 / 214.3
1 SLICK NMDC 30.04 !uumsxzs 6.25 6.25 5034 43.5 7 213.4




Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE WAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
Ridge Runner 1-30 Clear Creak September 30, 2007
NAME AND MUMBER couny Jstare oays from spud
'Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Emery Utah 18
AL DEPTH Rot. Hrs  Jaugm Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
6303’ 8 188.5 439’ 9 5/8" STC 36# J-55 3934.11 RKB‘ 20
JACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
TIH With Bit #6 C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
pauus KB TC GL.
15
TIME LOG
FROM Y0 | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 14:00 Drill Actual/ Sliding/ 5864'-5978'/ Rotating/ 5978'-611 5'1 gliding/ 6115-61 35'/ Rotating/ 6135-621 o
14:00 | 8.00 |Sliding/ 621 0'-6240/ Rotaﬁng@40‘-6303'
14:00 15:00 1.00 |[Circulate Welibore Clean
| 15:00 | 15:30 | 0.50 (Suivey
15:30 | 16:00 | 0.50 [Circulate After Survey To Equalize Annulus
16:00 | 20:00 | 4.00 JTOOH
20:00 | 21:00 | 1.00 IBreak Bit/ LD Mud Mtr/ Change O-Ring Rotating Head
21:00 | 21:30 | 050 [Make Up Bity MU Mud Mir/ Instal MWD Tool
21:30 | 23:00 | 1.50 |TiH With Bt #6
23:00 | 0:00 | 1.00 |Rig Repair/ Install Crown O Matic Control
0:00 1:30 1,50 |TIH With Bit #6 To 4078’
1:30 4:00 2.50 linstall Rotating Head Rubber/ Kelly Up/ Break Circulation/ Break Kely/ Blow Down Kelly/ Set Back Kelly
4:00 6:00 2.00 (TIH With Bit #6
(Y el oY el S W]
RECEIVED |
ocT o200
[ DIV. OF QIL, GAS
Total Hours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair | 1.00 | FUEL USED | 827/540 Gallons Boiler Hours NA up 158K
$irs. Mob./Demoll 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 1300 In 0 OutjDOWN 110K
{TOTAL DAYW 23.00 Total H20 used on well & road 0 Barrels JROTATE 138K
T MUD MATERIALS USED
Joerth 4829 INO. OF SACKS/LES PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 6 5 RR
TIME 7:00 2 Poly Plus ISIZE 8 3/4" 8 3/4
WEIGHT 8.4 Fed Seal | Security Smith
s 28 AL. Sterate TYPE EBX5265R M 516LKHPX
| 160 DAPP HFA Open 1.63
levre Fed-Zan beT Open 3x20/2x182x13
vt K-600 NO. 10874724 IW3042
fca 20 Fed 744 JoepmH out 6303'
leas Duragel N 6303' 3940
faix .0/1.3 C-325 TOTAL FEET 2363
Exs 7 Max Gel 50.50
Sawdust T/8/G
o 1,500 fpany cost $431200  JWT. ONBIT 10-20
{oare 4.0 Iprevious cost $22,276.00  IRPM 65/85
9%6SOLIDS 0.00 JcUMULATIVE cosT $26,588.00  JROP(iph) 46.8
ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD 1|
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT__[PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Indination / Azimuth
1 |BIT 1.00 Jmaxe Nat Nat 5881 44.20/209.80
1 |MOTOR 2283  lmooEL 8r80 | 8P80 5976’ 47.10/211.60
1 JPONY NMDC 10.02 JsTROKE 850 | 850 6069’ 46.10/211.80
1 JSLICK NMDC 30.04 !uum SIZE 6.25 6.25 6164’ 45,00/209.70
<« ‘f\lh (ol W al ~re - or ‘ot A ANRIN44 NN
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Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
NAME & WELL NO, FIELD DATE
Runner 1-30 Clear Creak October 1, 2007
RAME AMD NUNBER ICOUNTY ]srm Days from spud
Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 19
OTAL DEPYM Rat. Hrs  foum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED 1 AST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
6833 17 ] 2055 530' 9 5/8" STC 36# J-55 3934.11" RKBI 21
AT REFONT TIME REPORTED BY
Drill Actual C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
| Ixnmeu.
15
[ TIMELOG
FROM TO | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 10:00 4.00 iBreaking Circ.
10:00 11:00 1.00 |Wash And Reamed F/6240 T/6302
11:00 15:15 4.25 {Actual Drill F/6302' T/6427
15:15 15:45 0.50 |Survey
15:495 16:30 0.75 }Actual Drill F 6427/ T 6457
16:30 17:00 0.50 |Rig Service
17:00 18:00 1.00 lActual Drill F/6457' 7/6489"
18:00 5:00 11.00 lActual Drill F/6489' T/6833
5:00 6:00 1.00 JAccumulated Survey's
— Total Hours | 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair | 0.00 FUEL USED | 1266/600 Gallons Boiler Hours NA up 162K
Hrs. Mob./Demoly  0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 800 0 OutjDOWN 97K
[TOTAL DAYW! 24.00 Total H20 used on well & road 900 Barrels [ROTATE 127K
i
foePTh 6302 INO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME 8IT NO. 6
TIME 6:00A.M. 2 Poly Pius SIZE 8 3/4"
WEIGHT 8.3+ Fed Seal JMFG Security
VIS 28 1 AL. Sterate TYPE EBX526SR
jwL 120 DAPP TFA Open
IPvre 2 Fed-Zan T Open
meT K-600 SERIAL NO. 10874724 =
fca 20 fed 744 JoeeTH OUT 6833' L~ E
leas Durage! JoePi v 6303 U-'E § o3
fax 0/.8 c325 TOTAL FEET 530’ Z o |2
k:xs 7 MaxGel  JHRS 17.00 o — 1<
sawdust  J1/8/G =~ S 15
a 1,000 Joany cost 45,508.00  JwT. ON BIT 15/35 - IR= I
loare 8.0 JPrevious cost $26,588.00  IRPM 60/75 £ =
%SOLIDS TR. fcuMuLATIVE cosT $32,096.00  JROP(fph) 31.2 O
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT_ JPUMP NO 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 jBIT 1.00 | Nat Nat 6256 45.40/211.20
1 |MOTOR 22.83  |mooeL 8r80 | 8PS0 6340’ 44.3/211.4
1 {PONY NMDC 10.02 IsTROKE 8.50 | 850 6437’ 44.6/211.0
1 SLICK NMDC 30.04 jLnER s1ZE 6.25 6.25 6524 44.4/211.1
- PNA N e, - | pu— ne ~rnar PR




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069 7 45 RoE 536
DAILY DRILLING REPORT Y3-0ls -3 0085
LEASE MADIE & WELL NO. FIELD DATE .
Ridge Runner 1-30 Clear Creak October 4, 2007
JRIG MAME AND WUMBER county {state pays from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Emery ___ Utah 2
OTAL DEPTM Rot. s Jaem Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Repart No.
7050° 0 214.8 0 9 5/8" STC 36# J-55 3934.11' RKB 24
IACTIVIVY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED 8Y
Laying Down Drill String C.E. Crow/ R. M. Crow
psums KB TO GL.
Hole Sluffing & Running Sands 15
FROM Y0 HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 ]Cut & Slip 120 Driling Line
7:00 8:30 1.50 |TiH To 4000
8:30 9:30 1.00 |P/U Kelly & Break Circulation
9:30 10:30 | 1.00 |TIH 10-Stds To 50007 Break Circulation
10:30 | 11:00 § 0.50 |Rig Service
11:00 11:30 | 0.50 |Rig Repair/ Replace Rotary Chain
11:30 | 13:00 | 1.50 |TIH 10-Stds TO 8000/ Break Circ./ TIH 10-Stds To 68707 Break Circ.
13:00 | 15:30 | 2.50 |Wash & Ream Last 180' To Btm/6870"-7050'
15:30 17:00 1.50 |Circulate Btms Up/ Circ. Well Bore Clean For Laying Down Drill Striing
17-00 | 18:00 | 1.00 |RIG Up Lay Down Crew/ Safety Meeting Rig Personnel & Lay Down Crew
18:00 | 18:30 | 0.50 [Lay Down 3-Jts Drill Pipe/ Hole Sluffing in/ Work Tight Hole
18:30 19:00 | 0.50 |Break Circ/ Clean Up Hole/ Est. Returns Hole Freed Up
19:00 | 19:30 | 0.50 [Set Back Kelty & Blow Down/ Tight Hole Pulling 80-90K Over String Wt
19:30 | 22:00 2.50 |Kelly Up/ Est. Returns/ Pump Soap Sweeps/ Hole Cleaned Up
22:00 0:00 2.00 |Set Back Kelly/ Lay Down 3-Jts Drill Ppe/ Hole Pulling Tight/ Hole Sluffing/ Pulling 100k Over String Wt.
0:00 3:00 3.00 |Condition Mud/ Pump Gel & Poly Sweeps/ Hole Cleaned Up/ Unloaded Siuffing & Running Sand
3:00 6:00 3.00 |Lay Down Drill String
Total Hours 23.50 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair | 0.50 FUEL USED | 840/800 Galions Boiler Hours NA U 187K
Mob./Demoll 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours |200 0 OutjDOWN 114K
[TOTAL DAYW 24.00 Total H20 used on well & road {200 Barrels ROTATE 131K
l — .
7050' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 7
[TIME 10:00 Poly Plus | 3743 8 3/4"
WEIGHT 8.3+ Fed Seal MFG Reed
VIS 28 AL. Sterate [TYPE HP 53
N Pac-R (TFA Open
fPisve Myacide = Open
Hulls NO. DA3768
ICA 20 Magma Fiber  JDEPTH OUT
JGELS Duragel joermim Do m 7050
fax 0.0/2.4 c-325 TOTAL FEET A=A L)
E‘E 7 Max Gel RS 0.00
Sawdust T/B/G ae' 2 iBB:
la 2,600 loany cost $0.00 WT. ON BIT
loare 5.0 JPrevious cosT $49,434.00  JRPM DIV, OF OIL, GAS | Wil
%SOLIDS TR. MULATIVE COST $49,434.00 OP(fph)
RILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA
N0, DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  [PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 |BIT 1.00 fmaxe Nat Nat 6841' 43.90/207.90
4 6" DC 123.51  lmopEL 8P80 | 8PS0 6936' 42.90/208.00
9 {HWDP 277.33  lsTrRokE 8.50 | 850 7008' 41.90/208.30
1 }JARS HM) 29.74  JumeR s1zE 6.25 | 6.25
- Y Y ety e AN | PR ne




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069 77195 R 09F S-36
DAILY DRILLING REPORT Yz-0l5- 30680
FIELD DATE
Clear Creak QOctober 5, 2007
counTy Ysrate pays from spud
Emery Utah 23
LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
9 5/8" STC 36# J-55 3934.11' RKB 25
ﬁ‘l\ﬂ'ﬁ AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
rculating Casing wash to bottom. R.L.Tatman
KB TO GL.
;agg_d fill @ 7000’ 15
TIME LOG
FROM 10 | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 {Lay down drill pipe
7:00 7.30 0.50 |Change out swivel packing.
7:30 9:00 1.50 |Lay down drill pipe
9:00 10:30 1.50 |Rig down Kelly spinner / Break kelly
10:30 13:00 2.50 {Rig down BHA
13:00 | 13:30 | 0.50 |Rig up casing crew
13:30 | 23:00 | 9.50 |Run 164 jts.of 7" J-55, 23# Caasing to 7000° with Weatherford TRS Casers.
73:00 | 3:30 | 4.50 |Circuiate Pump LCM sweeps and wash down casing from 7000" to 7015’
3:30 4:30 1.00 |install Landing Mandreli and tanding joint.
4:30 6:00 1.50 ICirculate and wash down casingﬂ)m 7015'to 7028.77'
Total Hours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair | 0.50 | FUEL USED I 475  Galions | Boiler Hours NA up
. Mob./ 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 OutjDOWN
AL DAYW 24.00 Total H20 used on well & road Barrels IROTATE
———%&m————mm BIT ham
NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Poly Pius fs1ze
PWEIGHT Fed Seal
s AL Sterate  [TYPE
m Pac-R A
v Myacide _DET e
T Hulls NO. Rl T vioys
fea Magma Fiber out
kas Duragel PTH IN
faix c-325 TOTAL FEET
Eﬁ Max Gel O OF OIL, GAS & MM
Sawdust T/8/G
. LY COST 40.00 bwr. onBIT
p Jprevious cosT $49,434.00  JRPM
SOLIDS TIVE COST 449,434.00 OP{fph)
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT__|PUMP NO. ; 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
JMaxe Nat Nat
jmopEL 8p80 | 8P80
JSTROKE 850 | 8.50
JLiner s12E 6.25 | 6.25
IspM
!em




Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069 7T IYS R O£ S-20
G
DAILY DRILLING REPORT Y3-26H_ 30680
NAME & WELL NO. jaao DATE
Runner 1-30 Clear Creak October 6, 2007
NAME AND NUMBER counry {stare pays from spud
Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Emery Utah 24
AL DEPTH Rot. Hrs o Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Repoet Mo,
7050' 0 214.8 0 7" LTC 23# )-55 7028.17 ‘ 26
JACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
[Tear down R.L.Tatman
FBMRKS KB TO GL.
Bumped PluI% on second stage with 975 psi of lift and good returns (no cement to surf.) l 15
LOG
FROM 70 | HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 11:00 | 5.00 |Circulate, land Casing in head, Drop Float balls Seat mandrel, Rig up cement Crew.
11:00 Cement Casing Stage #1: 230 sx.50/ 50 PoZ with 10% sait . Bwow, 1/4 #/sx flocele @ 14.2 with a y.

of 1.62, Drop plug displace with drilling fiuid. Bumped plug @ 12:35 with 550 psi fcp. Chech fioats Fi4
Open stage collar with 2100 psi / Circulate, clear annufas with 435 bbls drilling fluld no retumns. Wait :
Stage #2: 655 sx Light Prem. With 16% gel 3% salt 3%/sx GR3, 1/4 sx flocele, 10#/sxGilsonite @ 11 p
with a yeild of 3.82 / Drop Plug Displace with fresh water Bumped Plug with 1500 psi over FCP of 97p51
Held pressure for 5 min Blead off DV Tool closed and casing is static. No returns through out Stage 14
19:00 | 8.00 |Good retum from displacement of stage 2 through Plug down No cement to surface.
19:00 | 19:30 | 0.50 |Rig down cement head and break out landing Joint.

19:30 | 0:00 | 4.50 [Clean mud tanks.Release rig to mob. rate at Midnight on October 7, 2007

0:00 6:00 { 6.00 |Tear down drain up Rig and Get ready for trucks.

— Total Hours | 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE =t=g" OILER HOURS [ STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair | 0.50 FUEL USED 370 Gaflons Boiler Hours NA jup
_Mob./Demol] 6.00 | Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out]DOWN
AL DA 18.00 Total H20 used on well & road | Barrels lROTATE ‘
MUD RECORD T MUD MATERIALS USED BITRECORD |
PEPTH Ino. oF sacksass PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Poly Plus S1zE
bt Fed Seal ure
s AL Sterate  fTYPE
| Pac-R FA
bvre Myacide hET
et Hubls ISERIAL NO. —
fer Magma Fiber __|DEPTH OUT ai= SN
lees Duragel DEPTH IN E‘T 122007
fak c-325 TOTAL FEET
hxe Max Gel JHrs o ‘
Sawedust T/8/G niy OF i*)lL Cho &Y
a Joary cost $0.00 . on eIt
loare JPREVIOUS COST $49,434.00  IRPM
9%SOLIDS JCUMULATIVE COST 44943400  JROP(fph)
DRILLING BLY — PUMP DA;LA
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - T [PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
Jmaxe Nat Nat
jmooEL 8pr80 | 8P80
JsTROKE 850 | 8.50
!uums:zs 6.25 | 6.25




NOTICE
Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-21 states that,

) 4 A well is considered completed when the well has been adequately worked to be capable
of producing oil or gas or when well testing as required by the division is concluded.

> Within 30 days after the completion or plugging of a well, the following shall be filed:
 Form 8, Well Completion or Recompletion Report and Log
* A copy of electric and radioactivity logs, if run
+ A copy of drillstem test reports,
* A copy of formation water analyses, porosity, permeability or fluid saturation
determinations
* A copy of core analyses, and lithologic logs or sample descriptions if compiled
A copy of directional, deviation, and/or measurement-while-drilling survey for
each horizontal well

Failure to submit reports in a timely manner will result in the issuance of a Notice of Violation
by the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, and may result in the Division pursuing enforcement
action as outlined in Rule R649-10, Administrative Procedures, and Section 40-6-11 of the
Utah Code.

As of the mailing of this notice, the division has not received the required reports for

Operator: Marion Energy, Inc Today’s Date: 02/14/2008

Well: APl Number: Drilling Commenced:

See Attachment
43 oIS 200
RIDGE” RUNNER 1-20
S TlE 7D

To avoid compliance action, required reports should be mailed within 7 business days to:
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining '
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801
If you have questions or concerns regarding this matter, please call (801) 538-5284.

cc: Well File
Compliance File



Well:

Cordingly Cyn 10-1
Ballpark Cyn 17-2
Alpine School Dist 6-17
Alpine School Dist 3-17
Kenilworth RR 15-4
Kenilworth RR 9-1
Ridge Runner 2-19
Ridge Runner 2-18
Ridge Runner 8-19
Ridge Runner 1-30

drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wcr
drlg rpts/wer
wer

drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wer

API Number:

4300731173
4300731169
4300731181
4300731182
4300731170
4300731172
4301530684
4301530683
4301530682
4301530680

Commenced:
05/19/2006
05/30/2006
06/26/2006
06/26/2006
07/05/2006
07/06/2006
08/10/2006
08/12/2006
08/13/2007
09/11/2007



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

USU-U-02353

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do rot use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing weils below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged welis, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Clear Creek Unit

1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

olLWELL [] GASWELL [] OTHER Ridge Runner 1-30

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APl NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc. 4301530680

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: ] PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT.

119 S. Tennessee iy McKinney orare TX 5575069 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: M487 ft FSL 1895 ft FWL county: Carberr Emer 7
IS|4 1Bl 20
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SW ¥ 148 7E STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

[] acioize [] oeeeen [J RePERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

l:l NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) [ ALtercasine [] rracrure TrReaT [] sietrACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [] casineRePar [J newconstrucTion [] temPORARILY ABANDON

[[] crance To PrREVIOUS PLANS [[] orerator crance ] tusing RePair
[] crance TusinG [] PLucanp aBanDON [ ventorrFLare

SUBSEQUENT REPORT [ cHance WeLL NAME [ ruceack [C] warerDisposaL

(Submit Original Form Oniy)
[] cHance wet sTaTUS [(] erobucTION (START/RESUME) [[] water sHuT-oFF
Date of work completion:

[[] commineLe PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE ¥] orer Update
[T] converTweLL TYpE [[] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12.  DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Currently waiting on completion.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Charlotte Parker e Secretary

4/4/2008

DATE

SIGNATURE M)ﬂ‘_h%@(} 1 hQ_ }7

{This space for State use only)

(5/2000) {See Instructions on Reverse Side)

RECEIVED
APR 14 2008
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING



RECEIVED
MAY 27 2088

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

AMENDED REPORT []
(highlight changes)

FORM 8

DIVISION OF OIL. GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
1 FALLR I/'\ _l 1=
V-OF ol GAS & Wi USU-U-02353
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIGE NAME
WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
1a. TYPE OF WELL: OiL GAS DRY OTHER 7. UNITorCA AGREEMENT.NAME
WELL WELL O Clear Creek Unit
b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WerL toRz [ e [ SNrry [ REsve [ OTHER Ridge Runner 1-30
3. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APl NUMBER:
Marion Energy, Inc. 4301530680
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
119 8. Tennessee #200 cirv McKinney state TX zp 75069 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) - 11. QTRIGTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,
ATSURFACE:  M4S7-f-FSE1885-ft-FWi : '
1514 £s\ MBL fo SW 10 145 T7E
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVAL REPORTED BELOW: 1487 ft FSL 1695 ft FWL 20
12. COUNTY 13. STATE
ATTOTALDEPTH: 1487 ft FSL 1695 ft FWL , o ' UTAH
53¢ )yl fel  por Dp | Emey
14. DATE SPUDDED: 15. DATE T.D. REACHED.  |16. DATE COMPLETED: Yevi e 17. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, GL).
9/13/2007 10/6/2007 2/16/2008 aganponeo [ ] READY TO PRODUCE 9815 GR
18. TOTALDEPTH: MD 7.048 5 O 19. PLUGBACKT.D: MD 7 ()28 20. IF MULTIPLE COMPLETIONS, HOW MANY? * [ 21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD
' : PLUG SET:
w BRD\ w 583 | ™D
22. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICAL LOGS RUN (Submit copy of each) 23,
DIL. CNL. FDC. CBL WAS WELL CORED? nofZl  ves[ ] (submitanalysis)
’ ’ ’ WAS DST RUN? Nnofe/]  ves[]  (submitreport)
DIRECTIONAL SURVEY? No[] ves (Submit copy)
24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in well)
HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE WEIGHT (#t.) TOP (MD) BOTTOM (Mp) | STAGE CEMENTER e o vofbuER(;BL) CEMENTTOP** | AMOUNT PULLED
17 1/4" 13 3/6 K55 54.50 0 540
12 1/4" 95/8 J-55 36# 0 3,891 5050P0: 950 Surface
12 1/4" 7" N-80 23# 0 7,028 5,885 5050P0: 230 Surface
PremLite 655 Surface
25. TUBING RECORD
SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) | PACKER SET (MD) SIzZE DEPTH SET (MD) | PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) | PACKER SET (MD)
2 3/8" 6,800
26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD
FORMATION NAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) | TOP (TvD) | BOTTOM (TvD) | INTERVAL (Top/Bot - MD) SIZE | NO. HOLES PERFORATION STATUS
» Ferron 6,378 6,930 6,476 6,664 43 208 |open /] ‘squeezed []

(B) Open D Squeezed D
©) Open D Squeezed D
(D)

Open D

Squeezed E

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNT AND TYPE OF MATERIAL

6476-6514

Frac'd w/ 750 gals 15% HCL, 40,000 # 20/40 sd & 37,386 gals Amborgel 1020

6566-6664

Frac'd w/ 750 gals 15% HCL., 50,000 # 20/40 sd & 44,200 gals Amborgel 1020

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS:

[C] eLectricaLmECHANICAL LOGS [] pstreporr

[ omer:

[] eEoLoGic REPORT

D SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGING AND CEMENT VERIFICATION D CORE ANALYSIS

E DIRECTIONAL SURVEY

30. WELL STATUS:

%

(5/2000) (CONTINUED ON BACK)



31. INITIAL PRODUCTION INTERVAL A (As shown in item #26)
DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION |OiL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: {PROD. METHOD:
4/22/2008 24 RATES: — 0 300 220 Pump

CHOKE SiZE: |TBG.PRESS. |CSG.PRESS. {APIGRAVITY [BTU-GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 124 HR PRODUCTION |OIL ~BBL: GAS — MCF: WATER —BBL: [INTERVAL STATUS:

RATES: = 0 300 220 Si
INTERVAL B (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION |OIL - BBL: GAS — MCF: WATER - BBL: |PROD. METHOD:
RATES: —

CHOKE SIZE: |TBG. PRESS. |CSG.PRESS. [APIGRAVITY |BTU-GAS GAS/OIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION |OtL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER ~BBL: {INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: =

INTERVAL C {As shown In item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION {OIL ~BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: |PROD. METHOD:
RATES: —

CHOKE SIZE: |TBG. PRESS. |CSG.PRESS. |APIGRAVITY |BTU~GAS GAS/OIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION {OIL — BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER -~ BBL: |INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: =

INTERVAL D (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION |OiL-BBL: GAS — MCF: WATER - BBL: |PROD. METHOD:
RATES: —
CHOKE SIZE: |TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. |API GRAVITY BTU -~ GAS GAS/OIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION |OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER ~ BBL: {INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: —
32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)
Vented
33. SUMMARY OF POROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION (Log) MARKERS:
Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.
" Top Bottom sk Top
Formation (MD) (MD) Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (Measured Depth)
Bluegate 6,159
Bluegate 6,159 6,378 |Shale Ferron 6,378
Ferron 6,378 | 6,930 }Sand, Gas, & Water Tunuck 6,930
Tunuck 6,930 Shale
35. ADDITIONAL REMARKS (Include piugging p dure)
36. U hereby certify that the foregoing and attached infor ion is plete and correct as determined from all avaitable records.
NAME (PLEASE PRINT) DTG Endsley e VP Operations

oare 3/20/2008

SIGNATURE

This report must be submitted within 30 days of

e completing or plugging a new well e reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
o drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore e significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
e recompleting to a different producing formation e drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM 20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from two or more formations.

** |TEM 24: Cement Top — Show how reported top(s) of cement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL), cement bond log (CBL), temperature survey (T: S)).

Send to: Utah Division of Qil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(5/2000)



MARION ENERGY, INC.

Ridge Runner #1-30

Sec. 30, T14S, R7E
Emery County, Utah

Plan #1
SECTION DETAILS
Sec MD inc Azi TVD +N/-8 +E/'W DlLeg TFace VSec Target
1 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 i
2 1050.0 0.00 0.00 1050.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 As Dﬂ"ed
3 10780 000 0.00 10780 0.0 00 000 000 00 10/2/107
4 2698.0 4050 214.00 2566.5 -455.2 -307.1 250 214.00 549.1 Final
5 63179 4050 214.00 5319.0 -2404.2 -1621.7 0.00 0.00 2900.0
6 7106.9 40.50 214.00 5919.0 -2829.0 -1908.2 0.00 0.00 34124
0— i - - - - e 500 e o e ‘ - 4
] | % | o y | !
H i i i ! i |
] i i i g . ] i ‘
600 _4; SR ,J, I v e “_ _ e j 0— ;
g KOP @ 1078 i ] i
- 1
1200— S i -t { ; -500—]
] : | ! : i i i ?
] i ; i | ! % = N i
. i E ‘% i ‘; g
1800— ! - e ; ; -t ©-1000— -
- ' ; : i : i 1= . f
i i I ; i H § (] 4 i
- i EOB @ 2698' j * * z R ? :
s : . : : ! ! T 7 | i
e D \..,;_,..__ﬁ_.,‘.,,.%-f... o b 1 L =-1500-—~] - -~ : i
————— ! | i ‘ 5 ] :
‘ £ ;‘
: 3::,’-2000—_- = 1
! 5 - ' .
i [s] i ] f
! w B | :
-2500— ]
] |
| ] PBHL- - - { |
| . ! . TD- Projection @ 7050 ,
* * . : f 3 E 7
} \ - } -3500 llIlilll(i|[lli|llli|!llillIliillii
Ferron | 3000  -2500  -2000  -1500  -1000 -500 0 500
| -7 West(-)/East(+) (1000 ft/in)
B e S -
1 : ! | : L
1 5 j : ., WELLBORE TARGET DETAILS
1. : i i ; b
S e s B ek S Name TVD +N/I-§ +EW  Shape
J! : i i R - i | Ferron 5319.0 -2404.2 -1621.7 Circle (Radius: 100.0)
1 ; ‘ }TD-PWEC‘ION@W?O Voo PBHL  5919.0 -2829.0 -1908.2 Circle (Radius: 100.0)
6600":"*;““' - .%,,, ; E :L ; J— P‘BHL..‘:
1 ! ; 1 : % !
- I LI L L I L i LU ‘ LI L | LN i LR L l 1 lK
] 600 1200 1800 2400 3000 3600

Vertical Section at 214.00° (1200 ft/in)

PROJECT DETAILS: Emery County

SITE DETAILS: Ridge Runner 1-30

Geodetic System: US State Plane 1927 (Exact solution)
Datum: NAD 1927 (NADCON CONUS)
Ellipsoid: Clarke 1866
Zone: Utah Central 4302

System Datum: Mean Sea Level

Site Centre Latitude: 39° 35'24.976 N
Longitude: 111° 10'0.266 W

Positional Uncertainity: 0.0
Convergence: 0.21

M
Azimuths to True North

Magnetic North: 12.13°

T
Magnetic Field
Strength: 52215.8nT)|
Dip Angle: 65.29°

Date: 8/31/2007
Model: IGRF200510




MARION ENERGY, INC.

Emery County
Ridge Runner 1-30
Ridge Runner 1-30
Original Hole

Survey: As Drilled

Standard Survey Report

02 October, 2007



Nevis

Survey Report
Company: MARION ENERGY, INC. Local Co-ordinate.Reference: Well Ridge Runner 1-30
Project: Emery County TVD Reference: WELL @ 9829.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Ridge Runner 1-30 MD Reference: - WELL @ 9829.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Well: Ridge Runner 1-30 Notth Reference: True
Wellbore: Original Hole Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Original Hole Database: EDM 2003.14 Single User Db
Project Emery County, Sec. 30, T14S, R7E
Map System: US State Plane 1927 (Exact solution) System Datum: Mean Sea Level
Geo Datum: NAD 1927 (NADCON CONUS)
Map Zone: Utah Central 4302
Site Ridge Runner 1-30
Site Position: Northing: 457,984.411 Latitude: 39° 35'24.976 N
From: Lat/Long Easting: 2,093,916.18ft Longitude: 111° 10" 0.266 W
Position Uncertainty: 0.0ft Slot Radius: " Grid Convergence: 021 °
Well Ridge Runner 1-30
Well Position +N/-S 0.0 ft Northing: 457,984 .41 ft Latitude: 39° 35'24.976 N
+EI-W 0.0 ft Easting: 2,093,816.18 ft Longitude: 111° 10" 0.266 W
Position Uncertainty 0.0 ft Wellhead Elevation: ft Ground Level: 9,814.01t
Wellbore Original Hole
Magnetics Mode} Name Sample Date Declination Dip Angle Fleld Strength
) © (n7)
IGRF200510 8/31/2007 12.13 65.29 52,216
Design Original Hole
Audit Notes:
Version: 1.0 Phase: ACTUAL Tie On Depth:
Vertical Section: Depth From (TVD) +N/S +ELW Direction
{f) ) (ft) ©)
0.0 0.0 0.0 214.00
'Survey Program Date  10/2/2007
‘From To s '
; () {9 Survey (Wellbore) Tool Name Description
§ 400.0 7,050.0 As Drilled (Original Hole)
1
Survey
Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Tum
Depth Inclination Azimuth ‘Depth *N/-§ +EI-W Section Rate ‘Rate Rate
0] © © ] (i) ") () {°1100m) {1100 (ri00f)
400.0 0.00 0.00 400.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
465.0 0.50 358.60 465.0 0.3 0.0 -0.2 0.77 0.77 0.00
558.0 0.50 19.20 558.0 1.1 0.1 -1.0 0.18 0.00 22.15
650.0 0.50 45.00 650.0 17 0.5 1.7 0.24 0.00 28.04
742.0 0.50 56.60 742.0 22 12 25 0.11 0.00 12.61
834.0 0.60 70.10 834.0 26 1.9 -3.3 0.18 0.11 14.67
926.0 0.50 83.30 926.0 28 28 -3.9 0.17 -0.11 14.35
1,034.0 0.60 90.00 1,034.0 2.9 38 45 0.11 0.09 6.20
1,128.0 1.60 202.40 1,128.0 1.7 3.8 -3.5 2.03 1.06 119.57
1,222.0 4.70 213.10 1,221.8 -2.8 1.2 1.6 3.34 3.30 11.38
1,316.0 6.90 222.30 1,315.3 -10.2 47 11.1 2.53 2.34 9.79
1,411.0 8.70 22540 1,409.4 -19.4 -13.6 23.7 1.95 1.89 3.26
1,505.0 11.10 223.50 1,502.0 -31.0 -24.9 39.6 2.58 2.55 -2.02

10/2/2007 8:47:45AM

COMPASS 2003.14 Build 77




Nevis

Survey Report

Company: "~ MARION ENERGY, INC. Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well Ridge Runner 1-30

Project: Emery County TVD Reference: WELL @ 9829.0ft (Original Well Elev)

Site: Ridge Runner 1-30 MD Reference: WELL @ 9829.0ft (Original Well Elev)

Well: Ridge Runner 1-30 North Reference: True

‘Welibore: Original Hole Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature

Design: Original Hole Database: EDM 2003.14 Single User Db

Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Iniclination Azimuth Depth +NI.S +ElW Section Rate Rate Rate
() Xy © " ] (e {f) rroofy  (Hoom) - (HooR)
1,600.0 13.20 224.30 1,594.9 454 -38.8 59.3 222 2.21 0.84
1,695.0 15.50 221.10 1,686.9 -62.7 -54.7 826 2.56 242 -3.37
1,790.0 18.00 220.10 17779 -83.5 -72.5 109.8 265 263 -1.05
1,882.0 19.20 222.40 1,865.1 -105.6 -91.9 138.9 1.53 1.30 2.50
2,008.0 22.90 220.60 1,982.7 -139.5 -121.8 183.8 2.98 294 -1.43
2,101.0 25.00 217.80 2,067.7 -168.8 -145.7 221.4 2.57 2.26 -3.01
2,165.0 2540 217.90 2,125.6 -190.3 -162.4 248.5 0.63 0.62 0.16
2,259.0 26.60 216.60 2,210.0 -223.1 -187.3 289.7 1.41 1.28 -1.38
2,353.0 28.50 212.50 2,2934 -258.9 -211.9 333.1 2.85 2.02 -4.36
2,448.0 29.70 214.10 2,376.4 -297.5 -237.3 379.3 1.51 1.26 1.68
2,541.0 30.90 213.50 2,456.7 -336.5 -263.4 426.2 1.33 1.29 -0.65
2,634.0 32.50 213.30 2,535.8 -377.3 -290.3 475.1 1.72 1.72 -0.22
2,727.0 33.70 211.50 2,613.7 -420.2 -317.5 525.9 1.67 1.29 -1.94
2,820.0 35.90 210.90 2,690.1 -465.6 -345.0 578.9 239 2.37 -0.65
2,916.0 38.30 211.70 2,766.7 -515.0 -375.1 636.7 2.55 2.50 0.83
3,010.0 40.10 212.90 2,839.5 -565.2 -406.8 696.1 2.08 1.91 1.28
3,104.0 41.20 213.40 2,910.8 -616.5 -440.3 757.3 1.22 117 0.53
3,197.0 41,70 213.40 2,980.5 -667.9 -474.2 818.9 0.54 0.54 0.00
3,291.0 41.00 212,70 3,051.1 -720.0 -508.1 881.0 0.89 -0.74 -0.74
3,386.0 40,40 212.00 3,123.1 -772.3 -541.2 9429 0.79 -0.63 -0.74
3,482.0 39.50 212.80 3,196.7 -824.3 -574.2 1,004.5 1.08 -0.94 0.83
3,577.0 39.70 213.10 3,269.9 -875.2 -607.2 1,065.1 0.29 0.21 0.32
3,668.0 39.80 212.80 3,339.8 -924.0 -638.8 1,123.2 0.24 0.1 -0.33
3,762.0 38.90 212.90 34126 -974.1 -671.1 1,182.8 0.96 -0.96 0.11
3,842.0 37.00 212.90 3,4756 ~-1,015.4 -697.9 1,232.0 237 -2.37 0.00
4,006.0 33.20 213.40 3,609.8 -1,094.3 -749.4 1,326.3 232 -2.32 0.30
4,099.0 34.30 214 .40 3,687.1 -1,137.2 -778.2 1,378.0 1.33 1.18 1.08
4,192.0 35.40 216.40 3,763.4 -1,180.5 -809.0 1,431.1 1.71 1.18 215
4,285.0 37.20 216.30 3,838.4 -1,224.8 -841.7 1,486.1 1.94 1.94 -0.11
4,380.0 38.70 216.60 3,913.3 -1,271.8 -876.4 1,544.4 1.59 1.58 0.32
4,471.0 40.10 217.90 3,983.6 -1,317.8 -911.3 1,602.1 1.79 1.54 1.43
4,567.0 41.60 217 40 4,056.2 -1,367.5 -949.7 1,664.8 1.60 1.56 -0.52
4,661.0 42.30 215.70 41261 -1,418.0 -987.1 1,727.5 142 0.74 -1.81
4,753.0 4280 21510 4,193.9 -1,468.7 -1,023.1 1,789.7 0.70 0.54 -0.65
4,848.0 43.80 214.90 4,263.1 -1,522.1 -1,060.5 1,854.9 1.06 1.05 -0.21
4,941.0 43.20 214.30 4,330.5 -1,574.8 -1,096.9 1,918.9 0.78 -0.65 -0.65
5,034.0 43.50 213.40 4,398.1 -1,627.8 -1,132.4 1,982.7 0.74 0.32 -0.97
5,127.0 43.60 211.40 4,465.5 -1,681.9 -1,166.7 2,046.8 1.48 0.11 -2.15
5,222.0 44.10 209.70 4,534.1 -1,738.6 -1,200.2 2,112.5 1.35 0.53 -1.79
5,316.0 44.50 210.20 4,601.3 -1,795.4 -1,233.0 2,178.0 0.56 0.43 0.53
54110 45.00 208.40 4,668.8 -1,853.8 -1,265.7 2,244.6 1.43 0.53 -1.89
5,505.0 45.90 210.60 4,734.7 -1,912.1 -1,298.7 2,311.4 1.92 0.96 2.34
5,600.0 45.50 211.00 4,801.1 -1,970.5 -1,333.5 2,379.3 0.52 -0.42 0.42
5,695.0 4570 211.00 4,867.6 -2,028.6 -1,368.4 2,447.0 0.21 0.21 0.00
5,787.0 44.50 211.30 4,932.5 -2,084.4 -1,402.2 2,512.1 1.32 -1.30 0.33
5,881.0 44.20 209.80 4,999.7 -2,141.0 -1,435.6 25777 1.16 -0.32 -1.60
5,976.0 47.10 211.60 5,066.1 -2,199.4 -1,470.3 2,645.5 3.34 3.05 1.89
6,069.0 46.10 211.80 5,130.0 -2,256.9 -1,505.8 2713.0 1.09 -1.08 0.22
6,164.0 45.00 209.70 5,196.6 -2,316.1 -1,540.4 2,780.7 1.96 -1.16 -2.21
6,256.0 45.40 211.20 5,261.4 -2,3714 -1,573.5 2,845.9 1.24 0.43 1.63
6,337.3 44.34 211.39 5,319.0 -2,420.4 -1,603.3 2,903.2 1.32 -1.31 0.24
Ferron

6,340.0 44.30 211.40 5,320.9 -2,422.0 -1,604.3 2,905.1 1.32 -1.31 0.24
6,437.0 4460 211.00 5,390.2 -2,480.1 -1,639.5 2,972.9 0.42 0.31 -0.41

10/2/2007 8:47:45AM

Page 3
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Nevis

Survey Report
Company: MARION ENERGY, INC. Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well Ridge Runner 1-30
Project: Emery County TVD Reference: WELL @ 9829.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Ridge Runner 1-30 MD Reference: WELL @ 9829.0ft (Original Well Elev)
“Wall: Ridge Runner 1-30 North Reference: . True
Welibore: Original Hole Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Original Hole Database: EDM 2003.14 Single User Db
Survey -
Measured , Vertical - Vertical  Dogleg Build: Turn
Depth Inclination - Azimuth Depth L NS +EI-W Section Rate. Rate Rate
) © © o] ) () () (°1100ft) (°1100%) °1100f)
6,524.0 44.40 211.10 5,452.2 -2,532.4 -1,670.8 3,033.8 0.24 -0.23 0.11
6,621.0 44 90 209.90 5,521.2 -2,591.1 -1,705.5 3,101.8 1.01 0.52 -1.24
6,715.0 44 80 208.80 5,587.9 -2,648.9 -1,738.0 3,167.9 0.83 -0.11 -1.17
6,841.0 43.90 207.90 5,678.0 -2,726.4 -1,779.9 3,255.6 0.87 -0.71 -0.71
6,936.0 42,90 208.00 5,747.0 -2,784.1 -1,810.4 3,320.5 1.06 -1.05 0.11
7,008.0 41.90 208.30 5,800.2 -2,826.9 -1,833.4 3,368.8 1.42 -1.39 0.42
7,050.0 41.90 208.30 5,831.4 -2,851.6 -1,846.6 3,396.7 0.00 0.00 0.00
TD - Projection @ 7050°
Targets
Target Name )
< hitimiss target Dip Angle Dip Dir. D +NI-S +EMW Northing Easting .
- Shape -0 €y () (i) (f) () (ft) Latitude Longitude
Ferron 0.00 0.00 5,319.0 -2,404.2 -1,621.7 455,574.19 2,092,303.45 39°35'1.212N 111° 10" 20.980 W
~ survey misses by 24.3ft at 6334.3ft MD (5316.8 TVD, -2418.6 N, -1602.2 E)
- Circle (radius 100.0)
Suivey Annotations
Measured Vertical Local Coardinates
Depth Depth +NI-S +El-W :
() () ) i) ~ " Comment
7.050.0 5,831.4 -2,851.6 -1,846.6 TD - Projection @ 7050
Checked By: Approved By: Date:

10/2/2007 8:47:45AM Page 4 COMPASS 2003.14 Build 77



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

AMENDED REPORT Iﬂ/
(highlight changes)

FORM 8

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

USU-U-02353

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE

NAME

1a. TYPE OF WELL: oL GAS 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME
WELL W b o [ CTHER Clear Creek Unit
b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Vel M IR B0 Hwed  REw OTHER _ Ridge Runner 1-30
2. NAME OF QPERATOR: 8, APl NUMBLER:
Marion Energy, Inc. 4301530680
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WH.OCAT
119 S. Tennessee #200 civ McKinney staie TX 20 75068 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat

4, LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES)

AT surrace: 1487 ft FSL 1695 ft FWL

11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,
MERIDIAN:

SW 19 14S TE
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVAL REPORTED BELOW: 1487 ft FSL 1695 f FWL
ATTOTALDEPTH: 1487 ft FSL 1695 ft FWL “Emery ERE GrAn
14, DATE SPUDDED: 16, DATE T D, REACHED, | 16, DATE COMPLETED, 17. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKE, RT, GL):
9/13/2007 10/6/2007 2/16/2008 asanoonen [ ] Reapy To PRODUCE 9815 GR
16. TOTALDEFTH:  MD 7 048 19. PLUSBACKT.D. MD 7 ()28 20 IF MULTIPLE COMPLETIONS, HOW MANY? * |21, DEPTHBRIDGE D
™D o ™D
22. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICAL LOGS RUN (Submit copy of each) 2.
DIL, CNL, FDC, CBL WAS WELL CORED? o/l ves[]  (submitanalysisy
WAS DST RUN? o] ves[]  submitrepory
DIRECTIONAL SURVEY? No[] ves[f]  (submitcopy)
24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report ail strings set in well)
HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE WEIGHT (/1) TOR (MD) BOTTOM(MD) | STAGE CEMENTER e = vofbulé}};su CEMENT TOP** | AMOUNT PULLED
17 1/4" 133 K55 54.50 0 540
12 14" 95/8 J-55 36# 0 3,891 5050Fy 950 Surface
12 1/4" o N-80 23 0 7,028 5,885 5050Rm 230 Surface
Premlgy 655 Surface
25. TUBING RECORD
SIZF DEPTH SET (MD) | PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTHSET (MDY | PACKER SET (MO) SIZE DEPTHSET (MD) | PACKER SET (D)
2 3/8" 6,800
26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD
FORMATION NAME TOF(MD) | BOTTOM(MD) | TOP(TvD) | BOTTOM (IVD) | INTERVAL (Top/Bot-MD) | SIZE | NO. HOLES PERFORATION STATUS
» Ferron 6,378 6,930 6,476 6,664| .43 208 |open |/] Ssqueezed [ |
(B} Open I:] Squeezad D
© open [ ] squsezea [ |
[(»)] open [_| Squeezad ]
28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.
DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNT AND TYPE OF MATERIAL

6476-6514

Frac'd w/ 750 gals 15% HCL, 40,000 # 20/40 sd & 37,386 gals Amborgel 1020

6566-6664

Frac'd w/ 750 gals 15% HCL, 50,000 # 20/40 sd & 44,200 gals Amborge! 1020

28, ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS:

30. WELL STATUS:

] ELecTRIGALMECHANICAL LOGS [] ceoloaicrerort [ vsTrerort ] DIRECTIONAL SURVEY Q?\C)D
[] suNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGING AND CEMENT VERIFICATION || CORE ANALYSIS (] omher
(B£2000) (CONTINUED ON BACK)

RECEIVED

MAY 2 0 2003

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



-

NITIAL PRODUCTION INTERVAL A {(As shown in item #26)
JATE FIRST PRODUGED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED. TEST PRODUCTION |OIL - BEL! (345 = MCF WATER —BBL  |PRGD. METHOD:
4/22/2008 3 RATES: — 0 110 15 Flowing
CHOKE SIZE! TBE. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. | AP GRAVITY BTU = GAS GASIOIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION |OIL - BBL: BAS = MCF: WATER - BBL. |INTERWA! STATUS:
n RATES: -
112 125 375 876 120 1P endsicng
INTERVAL B (As shown in item #26)
DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION |OIL —BBL: (3AS —MCF: WATER - B8L:  |PROD. METHOD:
RATES: =
GCHOKE §I1ZE:  |TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. APl GRAVITY BTU - GAS BAS/OIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION |OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER —BBL: |INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES, —
INTERVAL C {As shown in item #20)
DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: FEST PRCDUCTION |O1L—BBL:! GAS ~MCF: WATER - BBL:  |PROD. METHOD:
RATES: =
CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. £SG. PRESS, | API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION OlL-BBL: GAS — MCF: WATER - BBL: |INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: = l
INTERVAL D {As shown in item #26}
DATE FIRST PRODUCED TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION |OIL - BBL: 3A5 - MCF: WATER - BBL:  |PROD. METHOD:
RATES: —
CHOKE SIZE: TBG, PRESS. C8G. PRESS. AP GRAVITY BTU ~ GAS GAS/OIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION |OIL — BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER ~ BBL:  |INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES — l
32. DISPOSITION OF GAS {Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)
33. SUMMARY OF POROUS ZONES {include Aquifers): 34, FORMATION {Log) MARKERS:
Show all Important zones ef porosity and contents thersof: Corad Intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depih interval
tested, cushlon used, time tool open, flowlng and shut-in pressures and recoveries.
. Top Botiom s Top
Formation (MD) (MD) Descriptions, Contents, elc. Name (Measured Depth)
Blue Gate 6,159 | 6,378 [Shale Blue Gate 6,159
| Ferron 6,378 6,930 | Sand, Gas, & Water Ferron 6,378
Tunuck 6,930 Shale Tunuck 6,930
35. ADDITIONAL REMARKS (include plugging procedure)
16. 1 herehy certify that the foregaing and attached information is complete and gorrect as ¢ ined from all Hable records.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)_DOUY Endsley

nme VP Operalions

SIGNATURE

-

s/4/0]

This report must be submitted within 30 days of G
e completing of plugging a new well
e drilling horizontal laterals from an existing wall bore
e recompleting to a differant producing formation

o reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
e significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottorn-hole depth
® drilling hydrocarbon exploratary holes, such as core samples and stratigraphlc tests

* [TEM 20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from two or more formations.

! « |TEM 24: Cement Top —Show how reported top(s) of cement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL), cement bond log (CBL), temperature survey (TSH.

Sendto:  Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Fax:

(6/2000)

Phone: 801-538-5340

801-359-3840



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drili new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterais. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

oiLweLL [ ] GASWELL [ ] OTHER

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Mulit-Locations
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

1. TYPE OF WELL

Marion Energy, Inc. Yz 0ls Job 244}

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

119 S. Tennessee oiry McKinney srate VXK 7575069 (972) 540-2967 Clear Creek

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: county: Carbon
QTRIGTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RanGE, Meroian: S~ © 7 145 RO 7L STATE:
UTAH
", CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

[] acoize [] oeeren [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

M NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) [} atERcasinG [C] FrACTURE TREAT [[] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work wil start: [] casingRerAR [] wewconsTRUCTION [T] TeEmPORARILY ABANDON

[] cHaNGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [T] oPERATOR CHANGE ] Tueine RePair
[ cHanee Tueing 7] PLUG AND ABANDON [] venTORFLARE

] SUBSEQUENT REPORT [] cHance WELL NAME {1 Puesack [} warter pisposaL

(Submit Original Form Only)
[ cranee weLL sTATUS [T] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [C] waTeR sHuT-OFF
Date of work completion: .

[] coMMiNGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE 1 orer: remedial flush jobs
[J convert weLL TvPe [[] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATiONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, voiﬁmes, etc.

Recently Marion Energy conducted a series of short pump-in tests on the wells listed below to determine if the wells were in
need of remedial flushing of the Ferron formation. Those tests indicated that the wells were partially plugged with fines. It is
now our intention to start a larger series of remedial flush jobs in a cyclical manner consisting of periods of flushing followed by
a period of production. The length of each cycle will be determined by individual well response. Marion Energy will be utilizing
the necessary pumping equipment to achieve 3-5bbls/min and pressure up to 1800 psi. We anticipate starting these tests as
soon as we have removed snow from the access roads.

Ridge Runner 13-17 API # 4301530269, Ridge Runner 11-17 API # 4301530685, Ridge Runner 2-19 API # 4301530684,
Ridge Runner 1-30 API # 4301530680, Ridge Runner 11-20 API # 43015302710, ASD 3-17 API # 4300731182, ASD 6-17 API
# 4300731181, Oman 2-20 API # 4300730289

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) g Endsley TITLE VP Operations
! .

SIGNATURE & 7 \ &\D/LQ\’\ oare  3/15/2010

(This space for State use only} REQUEST DEN ' Eé/

Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining | RECEIVED
Dater\% / 3@ (O 5 204
(52000 By: \ )\ f\A ‘( \[ ) M (See Instructions on Reverse Side) MAR 1 ¢ 28 Hﬁ

£ tsobcreny lpr wbean @ Fosteficate DIV, OF OlL, GAS & MINING

KL S 2P i tests woeré not dotthe~2ed p‘e&t)& Pm‘“c‘(*. deteil g ‘ .
2#’*"’(’.‘:65‘621‘5\3'?5 l{[,é;tcj:?)p Gﬁglzx A u;\é.iqq v\‘h"\l t‘."(: -CT,!tc\, lr‘tfj\@k‘f»-gd ; dﬂ&é&pervformeé‘jabfoj Q:*C




Form 31605 U.. IDSTATES

FORM APPROVED b

(April 2004 DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Evpie: iaen 312007
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS JAD R R eE 3
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottec or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. ZU”} h."‘%R ] 8 Aﬁ Q: Lo
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side. 7. fUnit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
1. T 11 UTU - 301Y
ypeo Oil Well Gas Well [j Other

8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Or " Marion Energy, Inc.

Multi-Locations

9, API Well No.

3b. Phone No. (inchde area code)
972-540-2967

3a. Address
119 S. Tennessee Ste. 200 McKinney, TX 75069

Y3 o15° 306 &0

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., ., R, M, or Survey Description)
1S1Y FSL (936 Fuwl

S0 TS Ko)F AVESw

Clear Creek

11. County or Parish, State

Carbon

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
. [_] Acidize L peepen [ production (Start/Resume) Lt Water Shut-Off
Notice of Inent ] Atter Casing [ racture Treat Reclamation Wel Integrity
O [ Casing Repair Cl New Construction L Rocomplete Other Remedial Flush Jobs
Subsequent Report p
.y . [ change Prens [ prug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon
Final Abandonment Notice D Convert to Injection D Plug Back D Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. Ifthe operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only afier all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Recently Marion Energy conducted a series of short pump-in tests on the wells listed below to determine if the wells were in need of remedial
flushing of the Ferron formation. Those tests indicated that the wells were partially plugged with fines. It is now our intention to start a larger
series of remedial flush jobs in a cyclical manner consisting of periods of flushing followed by a period of preduction. The length of each cycle
will be determined by individual well response. Marion Energy will be utilizing the necessary pumping equipment to achieve 3-5bbis/min and
pressure up to 1800 psi. We anticipate starting these tests as soon as we have removed snow from the access roads.

/

Ridge Runner 13-17 API # 4301530269, Ridge Runner 11-17 API # 4301530685, Ridge Runner 2-19 API # 4301530684, Ridge Runner 1-30 API #
4301530680, Ridge Runner 11-20 API # 43015302710, ASD 3-17 APT # 4300731182, ASD 6-17 API # 4300731181, Oman 2-20 API # 4300730289

14. 1 hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Prirted/Typed)

DoBg.E{ldsley

Title VP Operations

soure Sy L 0L |

03/15/2010

(U THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approvedby _ _ _ _
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of

I ot R
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable --:J% 5 E Hoch

which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

e AUG 102010

PRICE FIELD OFFICE

Title 18 US.C. Section 1001 and Title43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make ita crime forany person knowing(l{y and willfully to make to any department or agency ofthe United
sdic

States any faise, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations a o anymatter within its juri

tion.

(Instructions on page 2)

COPY

UDOGM

REC )
AUG 16 2010

Ee 2zrntin N
9 pATRIIOY
N A

ey



Sundry Nunber: 74564 APl Well Nunber: 43015306800000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING U on353 '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below

current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION | 7-UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CLEAR CREEK
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well RIDGE RUNNER 1-30
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
UTAH GAS OPERATING SOLUTIONS,LLC 43015306800000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1415 North Loop West, STE 1250 , Houston, TX, 77008 281 540-0028 Ext CLEAR CREEK
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: EMERY
1514 FSL 1736 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 20 Township: 14.0S Range: 07.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
] acioize L] acTer casing [ casine repar
v NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [ chanee To PReVios PLANS O chance Tusine O chanee weLt nave
O CHANGE WELL STATUS O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS O CONVERT WELL TYPE
| SUBSEQUENT REPORT L] oeeren (] rraCTURE TREAT [J new consTrucTION
Date of Work Completion:
O OPERATOR CHANGE v PLUG AND ABANDON O PLUG BACK
O PRODUCTION START OR RESUME O RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE O RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
O TUBING REPAIR O VENT OR FLARE O WATER DISPOSAL
O DRILLING REPORT O WATER SHUTOFF O SI TA STATUS EXTENSION O APD EXTENSION
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER: |

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached procedure to plug and abandon the well Approved by the
Utah Division of
0il, Gas and Mining

Date: September 29, 2016

By: (\M I QMJ{—

Please Review Attached Conditions of Approval

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE
Patrick Merritt 281 540-0028 President
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 9/20/2016

RECEI VED: Sep. 20, 2016




Sundry Nunber: 74564 APl Well Nunber: 43015306800000

UTAH

DNR

.-A*....('

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

OIL, GAS & MINING

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43015306800000

Plug #2 should be placed above liner top from ~3891' to 3791".
Note: WCR indicates TOC @ surface. No CBL on file to confirm.
Prior to RIH with CICR, establish circulation through perfs @ 540'.

RECEI VED: Sep. 29, 2016



Sundry Nunber: 74564 APl Well Nunber: 43015306800000

RIDGE RUNNER 1-30 Plugging Procedure

Well Name: RIDGE RUNNER 1-30

APl Number: 43-015-30680

Location: NESW Sec.20-T14S-R7E Emery County, Utah
Surface Csg: 13 3/8” K-55 54.5# set @ 540’
Intermediate. Csg: 9 5/8” J-55 36# set @ 3891’

Prod. Csg: 7"N-80 23# @7,028'

PBTD: 7028’

1. MIRU well service rig. NDWH and NUBOP
2. Release the rods and POH with the rods

3. Release the 7” 45K TAC @6444’ and POH with 2 7/8” tubing, anchor and pump barrel

4. TIH w/ wireline set 7” CIBP. Set plug 60’ above top perf @ +/-6476’. TIH w/ 2 7/8” tbg and tag plug.
5. Pump cement through 2 7/8” thg setting a 100’ plug from +/-6416 — 6316 (approx. 20sx)

6. TOH w/tbg and TIH w/7” CIBP set at +/- 1800’

7. Pump cement through 2 7/8” tbg setting a 100’ plug from +/-1800" — 1700’ (approx. 20sx)

8. RU perforators and perforate @ +/-540’. Set a wireline set CICR at +/-525’. Sting into retainer and establish
circulation down the 7” csg and back up into the 7” X 9 5/8” & 9 5/8” X 13 3/8” annuli. If circulation cannot
be established through perfs sting out of retainer and set a 525’ plug (approx.108sx) to surface in the 7”
csg. If circulation can be established, pump 84sx cement in the 7 ”X 9 5/8” annulus to the surface and
180sx cement in the 9 5/8”X13 3/8” annulus, and sting out of retainer and set a 525’ plug (approx.108 sx)
to surface in the 7” csg on top of the retainer.

9. All cement should be Type Il or Class G or equivalent cement mixed at 5.2 to 5 gal/sk to make a slurry
weight of 15.8 ppg.

10. Erect dry hole marker on top of the plug extending 4 feet above the ground with following description:
OPERATOR: UTAH GAS OPERATING SOLUTIONS,LLC
WELL NAME & NUMBER: RIDGE RUNNER 1-30
API NUMBER: 43-015-30680
LOCATION: NESW SEC.20-T14S-R7E EMERY COUNTY, UTAH
11. In case the area is agricultural or cultivated, there is no need for marker and only cut off the casing 3’
below the ground level and cap it with above description welded on the cap.

RECEI VED: Sep. 20, 2016



Sundry Nunber: 74564 APl Well Nunber: 43015306800000

Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC
Ridge Runner 1-30 API:43-015-30680

Spud Date: 9/13/07
TD Date: 10/6/07
Comp Date: 2/16/08

SE NE NE Sec 30 (BHL)
SW NE SW (surface)
Sec. 20 T14S R7E
Emery County, Utah

Update 11-24-2015

From Scofield Store in Scofield Utah, go
7.9 miles south on Hwy 96 (264).

Note that at mile 3.3 stay right on

Hwy 264 toward coal mine. Do not take
left to Clear Creek. At 7.9 miles, Turn Left
on Trough Springs Ridge Road Might be
Skyline Dr. on Google. Follow main road
9.0 miles to Lower Ridge Pad where
RR1-30 is located.

Drilling Notes:
Directional Well:
KOP @ 1,030' +/-, Azim=90 deg
build 2 deg/100' to 44 deg @ 4,800' +/-,
and hold to TD @ 7,050', Azim=208 deg
Drill primarily w/ aireated water
Tight spots and lost circulation

No DST's or Cores taken

DV tool at 5,885’

Ferron (2/08)

6,476'-86', 6,500'-14" (4 spf)

Treat w/ 750 g 15% Hcl, 40,000 #'s 20/40
& 37,386 g Amborgel 1020

6,566'-74', 6,622'-36', 6,658'-64"' (4 spf)
Treat: 750 g 15% HCI, 50,000 #'s 20/40
& 44,200 g Anborgel 1020

TD = 7,048' MD, 5,831' TVD

KB 9,829
GL 9,815’

13-3/8", 54.5#, J-55 @ 540'
Cmtd w/ 560 sx
TOC @ surface

9-5/8", 36#, J-55 @ 3,891'
Cmtd w/ 950 sx
TOC unknown, partial returns

2-7/8" 6.5#, J-55, 8R EUE

6,444.76' TAC

6,676' SEATING NIPPLE FOR TBG PUMP.
6,741' EOT

2-1/4" x 36' TUBING PUMP

7".23#.)-55 @ 7.028'

Stage 1: 230 sx

TOC @ unknown, did not circ
DV tool @ 5,885’

Satge 2: 655 sx

TOC @ surface

RECEI VED:

Sep. 20, 2016
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