. STATE OF UTAH . FORM 3
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING AMENDED REPORT []
(highlight changes)
5. MINERAL LEASE NO: 6. SURFACE:
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL ML-21835 State
1A TYPE OF WORK: DRILL REENTER (]  DEEPEN [] 7 IF INDIAN. A L[L\fXEE OR TRIBSNANE:
srveorwel:  OIL ] Gas[]  OTHER SINGLE zoNE[Z]  muLTiPLE zONe [ * UN'””“?T;EMEN AME:
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. WELL NAME apd NUMBER:
Newfield Production Company ‘ State 6436-8-15
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
Route #3 Box 3630 ., Myton o UT 84052 (435) 646-3721 Modument Butte
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) ’, - 11AQTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,
S69755 ) Yo 675 950 /l\?ERIDIAN:
SENW 36 88 15E

atsurrace: SE/NW - 2099' FNL 2053' FWL ‘/‘f 2 {30! y

AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONE:

~)10.1$ 7924

14, DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:
. . UTAH
Approximately 12.3 miles southwest of Myton, Utah / Duchesne
15. DISTANCE TO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE (FEET) 16. NUMBER OF ACRES IN LEASE: 17. NUMBER OFf ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:
Approx. 2053’ f/ise line, NA' f/unit line 640.00 acres 40 acres
18. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING, COMPLETED, OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:
APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET)
Approx. 1270' / 6,315 #B001834
21. ELEVATIONS (SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATE DATE WORK WILY/ START: 23. ESTIMATED DURATION:
5761 GL &\;Q a(-\'f Aq (7) days from SPUD to rig release
24. PROPOSED CASING AND CEy}ATING PROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH / CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY, YIELD, AND SLURRY WEIGHT
12 1/4 8 5/8 J-55 24.0 300 Q{ass G w/2% CaCl 155 sx +/- 1.17 15.8
778 51/2 J-55 15.5 6,31;5»”Lead(Prem Lite H) 275 sx +/- 3.26 11.0
/| Tail (50/50 Poz) 450 sx +/- 1.24 14.3

25. / ATTACHMENTS

VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES:

WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER m COMPLETE DRILLING PLAN
EVIDENCE OF DIVISION OF WA? IGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER D FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANY OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER
NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Mar)\gy/CrOZIer R mme Regulatory Specialist
7 L o
: 3 2

SIGNATURE M/ S fn DATE /2/09

z !

\%4

{This space for Statedse only) RE CEEVED ,

API NUMBER ASSIGNED: [7[3 [ F- 3 L/ 2. Z&) APPROVAL: MAR ﬂ g 20(]9
DV, OF OlL, GAS & MINING

(11/2001) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
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WORKSHEET

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 03/09/2009

WELL NAME: STATE 6-36-8-15
OPERATOR: NEWFIELD PRODUCTION ( N2695 )
CONTACT : MANDIE CROZIER
PROPOSED LOCATION:
SENW 36 0808 150E
SURFACE: 2099 FNL 2053 FWL
BOTTOM: 2099 FNL 2053 FWL
COUNTY : DUCHESNE
LATITUDE: 40.07598 LONGITUDE: -110.18193
UTM SURF EASTINGS: 569755 NORTHINGS: 4436301
FIELD NAME: MONUMENT BUTTE ( 105 )
LEASE TYPE: 3 - State
LEASE NUMBER: ML-21835
SURFACE OWNER: 3 - State

APT NO. ASSIGNED: 43-013-34229

PHONE NUMBER: 435-646-3721

INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
Tech Review Initials Date
Engineering D IV q /Z'}/C)?
Geology ’ '
Surface

. PROPOSED FORMATION: GRRV
COALBED METHANE WELL? NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED:

LOCATION AND SITING:

v~ Plat R649-2-3.
Bond: Fed[] Ind[] Stal] Feel] Unit:
o (He01g3¢ )
L! Potash (Y/N) / R649-3-2. General
N 0il Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting: 460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920’ Between Wells
v~ Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception
(No. 43-7478 )
- Drilling Unit
N RDCC Review (Y/N) -
Board Cause No:
(Date: )
Eff Date:
¢y Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:
Mgl Intent to Commingle  (Y/N) R649-3-11. Directional Drill
COMMENTS : _I'(Lucé_("(]/_\wxftp (@3“@‘4‘»@}
\ Vi<
STIPULATIONS: |- %amm’ ;ﬁ P
W) M

2 - Statemeotr  oF

g%ﬂkétfé

53— Serbece Coq CokShy




¥ 4301334189 4301334188
FEDERAL 5-30-8-16 FEDERAL 6-30-8-16

4 35 4301334183 4301334184

34 it FEDERAL 11-30-8-16FEDERAL 10-30-8-14

4301334182 * *

FEDERAL 9-26-8-15 FEDERAL 12-30-8-16
4301334216 ¢ N -30-8-
FEDERAL 10-26-8-15
25 30
26
4301334180
aiitad ’FEDERAL 14-30-8-16
.FEDERAL 15-26-8-15 Feoégf ?§j§8-8-1 6
®
4301334214 s
FEDERAL 16-26-8-15
: SRIAED 4301334199 5
4301334233 , oAy
4301331525 4301334231 STATE 2-36.8.15 STty / R WPQ!NT PED3- 3148- 1e
CODY FEDERAL 2-35 (REENTRY) STATE 4- 3‘36 815 : b 4301534234 3 7 430133‘“98 b
4301334232 STATE 1-36-8-14~ w pom‘r FED 4-31-5 15 Ay
e *i STATE 3:36:8-15 +
+ ; A i
e 7 > '// 7 % % 5 e : ‘ 3 ;
ASOABBA228 0. e i e

ek STATE 8-36-8-14" /7 /7 7 4301332116 :
: , 4301330934 - e e A 4301332115 WEST PO}NT7 31 -8-14

4301334230 4301334229 WELLS DRAW.ST7-36 : ¥ ; WESTPOINTs 31 16 > X

STATE 5-36-8-15 A e R ;0133231.14 o N

: 36 ‘ A,
4301334224 4301334225 KA & 01 212’1 5. '4301-331‘ Y
O Tedtee: 4301354206 4301334227 7 WESTPOINT 12-3 8‘3$AON FED 23-318-16Y

, 4301331021
XANTELOPE CREEK 1- 3540

3 STATE 12- 36 8-15
X

4301 334223
+STATE 13-36- -8-15

STATE11:36-8-15
> ‘ NI

; 4301334222
+STATE 14- 36 8-15

STATE 10-36-8-15 STATE 9-36- 814~
L L ;

[14301334221
‘+STATE 15:36-8-15

; 4301330451

STATE 44-36

§ 43013’34204 "4301332120

NTF/ED 11:318;

4 430133)780, 4301332015 5

v “ MON FED24- 3181€NJNEMILE14 A
A 4301382122 ./ K7 A 7
g yveswomns -3 816 Yt

API Number: 4301334229
Well Name: STATE 6-36-8-15

Township 08.0 S Range 15.0 E Section 36

Meridian: SLBM

Operator: NEWFIELD PRODUCTION COMPANY

Map Prepared:
Map Produced by Diana Mason

Units Wells Query Events

STATUS ><
| T <all other values>
[ Jactve

[ ] expLorATORY GIS_STAT_TYPE
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[ Aerion S e
Y Jrraas _*_ "
[ pp cEOTHERML
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[ Jrerminatep /o oPs
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@ row
RET
Sections
Ehwnshm ‘ﬁ‘ S0
—@— sow
T
O W
& wo
S ow
® s

430133181 6
NINE MiLE 3-6

4301391952
' NINEMILE4-6 ¥

Box Elder

e

Uintah

Tooele

Carbon

Millard

Sevier

Beaver piuq Wayne 15

op Garfield
San Juan

Washington Kane ,,-j}.
DNR
<t
1,500 750 0 1,500 Feet
TR 2 AR

1:13,261




gpplicaﬁon for Permit to Drill
Statement of Basis

3/12/2009 Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Page 1
APD No API WellNo Status Well Type Surf Ownr CBM
1312 43-013-34229-00-00 ow S No
Operator NEWFIELD PRODUCTION COMPANY Surface Owner-APD

Well Name STATE 6-36-8-15 Unit

Field MONUMENT BUTTE Type of Work

Location SENW 36 85 15E S 2099 ENL 2053 FWL  GPS Coord (UTM) 569755E 4436301N

Geologic Statement of Basis
Newfield proposes to set 300" of surface casing at this location. The base of the moderately saline water at this
location is estimated to be at a depth of 450". A search of Division of Water Rights records shows no water
wells within a 10,000 foot radius of the center of section 36. The surface formation at this site is the Uinta
Formation. The Uinta Formation is made up of interbedded shales and sandstones. The sandstones are mostly
lenticular and discontinuous and should not be a significant source of useable ground water. The surface casing
should be extended to cover the base of the moderately saline ground water.

Brad Hill 3/12/2009
APD Evaluator Date / Time

Surface Statement of Basis
The general location is approximately 12 road miles southwest of Myton, UT in the upper portion of the
Pleasant Valley Drainage. Wells Draw is approximately 2 miles to the east and the Ute Tribal Indian
Reservation 1 mile to the west. Broad flats with rolling hills characterize the area. Flats are often intersected by
drainages with gentle to moderate side slopes. Flats at lower elevations to the northeast are frequently used for
agriculture. No seeps, springs or streams are known to exist in the immediate area. An occasional pond for
livestock watering occurs. Pleasant Valley Wash drains into the Pariette Draw drainage of Duchesne County.
The lower reaches of both of these draws contain perennial streams somewhat consisting of irrigation runoff and
seepage. Pariette Draw runs into the Green River approximately 6 miles downstream from Ouray, Utah and
about 18 miles down drainage from the area. Access is by State and County and existing or proposed oilfield
development roads to within 830 feet of the site. From this point additional construction will be required.

The proposed State 6-36-8-15 oil well location is laid out longitudinally across a flat with a very gentle slope to
the north. No drainages intersect the location and no diversions will be required. The proposed site appears to
be a suitable location for constructing a pad and drilling and operating a well.

Both the surface and minerals are owned by SITLA. Ed Bonner and Jim Davis of SITLA were invited to the pre-
site evaluation. Neither attended.

Pat Rainbolt and Ben Williams represented the Utah Division of Wildlife Resources. Mr. Rainbolt stated the
area was classified as substantial value antelope habitat but did not recommend any restrictions for this species
No other wildlife should be significantly affected. Mr. Rainbolt gave Mr. Eaton of Newfield Production
Company a copy of his written evaluation and also a UDWR seed mix recommendation to be used when the
reserve pit and location are reclaimed.

Floyd Bartlett 3/4/2009
Onsite Evaluator Date / Time



3/12/2009

Application for Permit to Drill
Statement of Basis
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Page 2

Conditions of Approval / Application for Permit to Drill

Category
Pits

Surface

Condition

A synthetic liner with a minimum thickness of 16 mils with a felt subliner shall be
properly installed and maintained in the reserve pit.

The reserve pit shall be fenced upon completion of drilling operations.



ON-SITE PREDRILL EVALUAT&‘I
Utah Division of Qil, Gas and Mining

Operator NEWFIELD PRODUCTION COMPANY

Well Name STATE 6-36-8-15

API Number 43-013-34229-0 APD Neo 1312 Field/Unit MONUMENT BUTTE
Location: 1/4,1/4 SENW Sec 36 Tw 8S Rng 15E 2099 FNL 2053 FWL

GPS Coord (UTM) 569764 4436301 Surface Owner

Participants
Floyd Bartlett (DOGM), Tim Eaton and Brian Foote (Newfield Production Company), Ben Williams and Pat Rainbolt
(Utah Division of Wildlife Resources).

Regional/Local Setting & Topography
The general location is approximately 12 road miles southwest of Myton, UT in the upper portion of the Pleasant Valley
Drainage. Wells Draw is approximately 2 miles to the east and the Ute Tribal Indian Reservation 1 mile to the west. Broad
flats with rolling hills characterize the area. Flats are often intersected by drainages with gentle to moderate side slopes.
Flats at lower elevations to the northeast are frequently used for agriculture. No seeps, springs or streams are known to exist
in the immediate area. An occasional pond for livestock watering occurs. Pleasant Valley Wash drains into the Pariette
Draw drainage of Duchesne County. The lower reaches of both of these draws contain perennial streams somewhat
consisting of irrigation runoff and seepage. Pariette Draw runs into the Green River approximately 6 miles downstream
from Ouray, Utah and about 18 miles down drainage from the area. Access is by State and County and existing or
proposed oilfield development roads to within 830 feet of the site. From this point additional construction will be required.

The proposed State 6-36-8-15 oil well location is laid out longitudinally across a flat with a very gentle slope to the north.
No drainages intersect the location and no diversions will be required. The proposed site appears to be a suitable location
for constructing a pad and drilling and operating a well.

Both the surface and minerals are owned by SITLA. Ed Bonner and Jim Davis of SITLA were invited to the pre-site
evaluation. Neither attended.

Pat Rainbolt and Ben Williams represented the Utah Division of Wildlife Resources. Mr. Rainbolt stated the area was
classified as substantial value antelope habitat but did not recommend any restrictions for this species No other wildlife
should be significantly affected. Mr. Rainbolt gave Mr. Eaton of Newfield Production Company a copy of his written
evaluation and also a UDWR seed mix recommendation to be used when the reserve pit and location are reclaimed.

Surface Use Plan
Current Surface Use

New Road
Miles Well Pad Src Const Material Surface Formation
Width Length
Ancillary Facilities

Waste Management Plan Adequate?

Environmental Parameters
Affected Floodplains and/or Wetland N

Flora / Fauna
A good desert shrub type consisting of blue gramma grass, shadscale, greasewood, black sage, broom snakeweed,
needle and thread grass, rabbitbrush, prickly pear, fridge sage, winter fat, curly mesquite grass and spring annuals

3/12/2009 Page 1



Cattle, prairic dogs, antelope, small mammals and birds.

occupies the area.

Soil Type and Characteristics

Deep sandy loam

Erosion Issues N

Sedimentation Issues N

Site Stability Issues N

Drainage Diverson Required N

Berm Required? N

Erosion Sedimentation Control Required? N

Paleo Survey Run? N Paleo Potental Observed? N

Reserve Pit

Site-Specific Factors

Distance to Groundwater (feet) 100 to 200
Distance to Surface Water (feet) >1000
Dist. Nearest Municipal Well (ft)  >5280

Distance to Other Wells (feet) >1320

Native Seil Type Maod permeability
Fluid Type Fresh Water
Drill Cuttings Normal Rock
Annual Precipitation (inches) <10

Affected Populations <10

Presence Nearby Utility Conduits  Not Present

Characteristics / Requirements
A 50° x 70" x 8' deep reserve pit is planned in an area of cut on the northeast side of the location. A pit liner is

required. Newfield commonly uses a 16-mil liner.

Cultural Survey Run? Y  Cultural Resources? N

Site Ranking
5

0

0

0

10

SO O D W

Final Score 20

1 Sensitivity Level

Closed Loop Mud Required? N  Liner Required? Y Liner Thickness 16 Pit Underlayment Required? Y

Other Observations / Comments

Floyd Bartlett
Evaluator

3/4/2009
Date / Time

3/12/2009

Page 2



. 43013342290000 State 6-36-8-15
Casing Schem 3’ti;g: §B>’-’
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Well name: 43013342290000 State 6-36-8-15
Operator: Newfield Production Company

String type:  Surface

Location: Duchesne County

Project ID:
43-013-34229-0000

Design parameters:

Minimum design factors:

Environment:

Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 71 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 185 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 203 ft
Burst
Max anticipated surface
pressure: 396 psi
Internal gradient: 0.120 psi/ft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 450 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)
Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:
Next setting depth: 6,315 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.400 ppg
Neutral point: 393 ft Next setting BHP: 2,756 psi
Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 450 ft
Injection pressure: 450 psi
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter = Capacity
(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) ) (ft) (in) (ft’)

1 450 8.625 24.00 J-55 ST&C 450 450 7.972 160.9
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension  Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load - Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor {psi) (psi) Factor {Kips) (Kips) Factor

1 196 1370 6.977 450 2950 6.56 11 244 2259 J

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 810-538-5357 Date: April 14,2009

by: Div of Oil,Gas & Mining
ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE

Salt Lake City, Utah

Coliapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 450 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



43013342290000 State 6-36-8-15

Well name:

Operator:

String type:  Production
Location: Duchesne County

Newfield Production Company

Project ID:
43-013-34229-0000

Design parameters:

Minimum design factors:

Environment:

Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 153 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 368 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 706 ft

Burst

Max anticipated surface
pressure: 1,366 psi
Internal gradient: 0.220 psi/ft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 2,756 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)
. 8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)
Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body vyield: 1.50 (B)
Tension is based on buoyed weight.
Neutral point: 5612 ft
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) () (in) (ft*)

1 6315 5.5 15.50 J-55 LT&C 6315 6315 4.825 843.9
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension  Tension Tension
Seq Load  Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

{psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor

1 2756 4040 1.466 2756 4810 1.75 85 217 254 J

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 810-538-5357 Date: April 14,2009

by: Divof Oil,Gas & Mining
ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE

Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 6315 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Salt Lake City, Utah

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



BOPE REVIEW

Newfield State 6-36-8-15 _ API 43-013-34229-0000

INPUT

Well Name Newfield State 6-36-8-15 AP 43-013-34229-0000
String 1 String 2

Casing Size (") 8 5/8 51/2]

Setting Depth (TVD) 450 6315

Previous Shoe Setting Depth (TVD) 0 450

Max Mud Weight (ppg) 8.4 8.4] v

BOPE Proposed (psi) 0 2000

Casing Internal Yield (psi) 2950 4810

Operators Max Anticipated Pressure (psi) 2734 83 ppg

ICaIcuIations String 1 85/8 " |

lﬁx BHP [psi] 052" Setting Depth"MW =] 197

BOPE Adequate For Drilling And Setting Casing at Depth?

[MASP (Gas) [psi] Max BHP-(0.12*Setting Depth) = 143 NO Air drill
[MASP (Gas/Mud) fpsi] Max BHP-(0.22"Setting Depth) = 98 NO
F o *Can Full Expected Pressure Be Held At Previous Shoe?
Pressure At Previous Shoe | Max BHP-.22*(Setting Depth - Previous Shoe Depth) = 98 NO [reasenanle e Db, a0 dres
|Required Casing/BOPE Test Pressure 450]psi '
*Max Pressure Allowed @ Previous Casing Shoe = 0]psi *Assumes 1psifft frac gradient
Calculations String 2 512 " |
Max BHP [psi] .052"Setting Depth"MW =] 2758
BOPE Adequate For Drilling And Setting Casing at Depth?
[MASP (Gas) [psi] Max BHP-(0.12*Setting Depth) = 2001 NO Air Drill
|MASP (Gas/Mud) [psi] Max BHP~(0.22*Setting Depth) = 1369 YES v
{ ‘ ' *Can Fult Expected Pressure Be Held At Previous Shoe?
{Pressure At Previous Shoe [ Max BHP-.22*(Setting Depth - Previous Shoe Depth) = 1468 < NO LK ewsonaple ’

Required Casing/BOPE Test Pressure

2000

*Assumes 1psifft frac gradient

*Max Pressure Allowed @ Previous Casing Shoe =
g ‘

/
Olpsi ) «
—




| (04/02/2009) Diaﬁa’Masoh-NeWiéld,A‘vals (14) o . _ Paget

From: Jim Davis

To: Bonner, Ed; Mason, Diana

Date: 4/2/2009 10:49 AM

Subject: Newfield Approvals (14)

CC: Garrison, LaVonne; mcrozier@newfield.com; teaton@newfield.com

The following wells have been approved by SITLA including arch and paleo clearance.
Newfield Production's State 5-36-8-15 [API #4301334230}
Newfield Production's State 2-36-8-15 [API #4301334233]
Newfield Production's State 15-36-8-15 [API #4301334221]
Newfield Production's State 14-36-8-15 [API #4301334222]
Newfield Production's State 13-36-8-15 [API #4301334223]
Newfield Production's State 12-36-8-15 [API #4301334224]
Newfield Production's State 11-36-8-15 [API #4301334225]
Newfield Production's State 1-36-8-15 [API #4301334234]
Newfield Production's State 10-36-8-15 [API #4301334226]
Newfield Production's State 9-36-8-15 [API #4301334227]
Newfield Production's State 8-36-8-15 [API #4301334228]
Newfield Production's State 6-36-8-15 [API #4301334229]
Newfield Production's State 3-36-8-15 [API #4301334232]
Newfield Production's State 4-36-8-15 [API #4301334231]

-Jim

Jim Davis

Utah Trust Lands Administration
jimdavis1@utah.gov

Phone: (801) 538-5156



STATE OF UTAH FORM 3
S i e —-— - - CDEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESCURCES
DIVISION OF Oll., GAS AND MINING AMENDED REPORT [_]
{rightight changes)
] & MINERAL LEASE NO: € SURFACE.
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL ML-21835 State
7.IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
1A, TYPE OF WORK: DRILLZ]  REENTER []  DEEPEN [ A
. CA AGREEMENT © N
ereeornen: O ) cas[] OTHER SINGLE ZONE [Z]  MuLTIPLE ZONE[]] U A T NAKIE
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: ) ) G PELL HARE and NUMBER
Newifield Production Company Siate 6-36-8-15
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHOMNE NUMBER: 10, FIELO AND POGL, OR WALLGAT:
Route #3 Box 3830 ey Myton L UT 84082 {435) 646-3721 Monument Butlte
A LOCATION OF WELL IFOOTAGES) - o 16 ] TV, TORRGHER. RARTE
, B LITsS X Lo. 015G | wen
arsurrace: SE/MW 2009 FNL 2083 FWL SEsY 28 8 18
- v ——" lo Ig lcfl‘? SEMW a8 88 el
AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONE: HH3L3 ol { g
14 DISTAMCE 1M MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICK: 12 GO 13 STATE:
, \ UTAH
Approximately 12.3 miles southwest of Myton, Utah Duchesna
15, ISTANCE TO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE (FEET) 15, NUMBER OF ACRES IN LEASE; 17 MUMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIG WELL:
Approx. 2053 ffise line, NA' ffunit line 640.00 acres 40 acres
1B, DISTANGE TO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING, COMPLETED, OR 15 FROPGGED DEPTRE 20 BOND DESCRIPTION:
APPLIED FOR} ON THIS LEASE (FEET)
Approx, 1270 8,315 #B001834
21, ELEVATIONS (SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, EYGE 22, ABRROXIMATE DATE WORK Wil START: 23 ESTIMATED DURATION:
5761 GL g N Qe 200 (7) days from SPUD to rig release
24, ) PROPCOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT : BETHNG BEPTH ‘ CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY, YIELD, AND SLURRY WBGHT
12 114 8 5/8 J-55 24.0 450 | Class G w/2% CaCl 155 sx +/i- 1.17 15.8
7718 5172 J-55 15.5 6,315 | Lead{Prem Lite Il) 275 sx +i- 3.26 11.0
Tall (50/50 Poz) 450 sx +/- 1.24 14.3
25 ATTACHMENTS
VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED iN AGCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OiL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES!
E WELL PLAT DR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER @ COMPLETE DRILLING PLAN
EVIDENCE: OF DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FORUSE OF WATER B FORM 5, {F OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANY OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

NAME (PLease privry MandieCrozier 7 me Regulatory Specialist
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NEWFIELD PRODUCTION COMPANY
STATE 6-36-8-15
SE/NW SECTION 36, T8S, RI5SE
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH
TEN POINT DRILLING PROGRAM
GEOLOGIC SURFACE FORMATION:

Uinta formation of Upper Eocene Age

ESTIMATED TOPS OF IMPORTANT GEQLOGIC MARKERS:

Uinta 0-1,585
Green River 1,585’
Wasatch 6,315’

ESTIMATED DEPTHS OF ANTICIPATED WATER, OIL, GAS OR MINERALS:

Green River Formation (Oil) 1,585*—-6,315°

Fresh water may be encountered in the Uinta Formation, but would not be expecied below about
350", All water shows and water bearing geologic units shall be reported to the geologic and
engineering staff of the Vernal Office prior to running the next string of casing or before plugging
orders are requested. All water shows must be reported within one (1) business day after being
encountered.

All usable (<10,000 PPM TDS) water and prospectively valuable minerals (as described by BLM
at onsite) encountered during drilling will be recorded by depth and adequately protected. This
information shall be reported to the Vernal Office.

Detected water flows shall be sampled, analyzed, and reported to the geologic & engineering staff
of the Vernal Office. The office may request additional water samples for further analysis. Usage
of the Statc of Utah form Report of Water Encountered is acceptable, but not required.

The following information is requested for water shows and samples where applicable:

Location & Sampled Interval Date Sampled

Flow Rate Temperature

Hardness pH

Water Classification (State of Utah) Dissolved Calcium (Ca) (mg/l)
Dissolved Iron (Fe) (ug/l) Dissolved Sodium (Na) (mg/l)
Dissolved Magnesium (Mg) (mg/]) Dissolved Carbonate (CO;) (mg/1)
Dissolved Bicarbonate (NaHCO3) (mg/1) Dissolved Chloride (C1) (mg/1)
Dissolved Sulfate (SO,) (mg/1) Dissolved Total Solids (TDS) (mg/1)

PROPOSED CASING PROGRAM:

Surface Casing: 8-5/8” J-55 24# w/ST&C collars; set at 450’ (New)
Production Casing:5-1/2” J-55, 15.5# w/LT&C coilars; set at TD (New or used, inspected).

MINIMUM SPECIFICATIONS FOR PRESSURE CONTROL:

The operator’s minimum specifications for pressure control equipment are as follows:

RECEIVED

APR 0 3 2009
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
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An 8” Double Ram Hydraulic unit with a closing unit will be utilized. Function test of BOP’s will
be check daily.

Refer to Exhibit C for a diagram of BOP equipment that will be used on this well.

6. TYPE AND CHARACTERISTICS OF THE PROPOSED CIRCULATION MUDS:

From surface to £350 feet will be drilled with an air/mist system. The air rig is equipped with a 6
15” blooie line that is straight run and securely anchored. The blooie line is used with a discharge
less than 100 ft from the wellbore in order to minimize the well pad size. The blooie line is not
equipped with an automatic igniter or continuous pilot light and the compressor is located less
than 100 ft from the well bore due to the low possibility of combustion with the air dust mixture.
The trailer mounted compressor (capacity of 2000 CFM) has a safety shut-off valve which is
located 15 feet from the air rig. A truck with 70 bbls of water is on stand by to be used as kill
fluid, if necessary. From about 350 feet to TD, a fresh water system will be utilized. Clay
inhibition and hole stability will be achieved with a KCl substitute additive. This additive will be
identified in the APD and reviewed to determine if the reserve pit shall be lined. This fresh water
system will typically contain Total Dissolved Solids (TDS) of less than 3000 PPM. Anticipated
mud weight is 8.4 lbs/gal. If necessary to contro} formation fluids or pressure, the system will be
weighted with the addition of bentonite gel, and if pressure conditions warrant, with barite.

No chromate additives will be used in the mud system on Federal and/or Indian lands without
prior BLM approval to ensure adequate protection of fresh aquifers. .
No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA Title III in an amount equal to or greater than
10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in association
with the drilling, testing, or completing of this well. Furthermore, no extremely hazardous
substances, as defined in 40 CFR 3535, in threshold planning quantities, will be used, produced,
stored, transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling, testing, or completing of this
well.

Hazardous substances specifically listed by the EPA as a hazardous waste or demonstrating a
characteristic of a hazardous waste will not be used in drilling, testing, or completion operations.

Newfield Production will visually monitor pit levels and flow from the well during drilling
operations.

7. AUXILIARY SAFETY EQUIPMENT TO BE USED:

Auxiliary safety equipment will be a Kelly Cock, bit float, and a TTW valve with drill pipe
threads.

8. TESTING, LOGGING AND CORING PROGRAMS:

The logging program will consist of a Dual Induction, Gamma Ray and Caliper log from TD to
base of surface casing @ 300’ +/-, and a Compensated Neutron-Formation Density Log from TD
to 3500’ +-. A cement bond log will be run from PBTD to cement top. No drill stem testing or
coring is planned for this well.

9. ANTICIPATED ABNORMAL PRESSURE OR TEMPERATURE:

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No hydrogen sulfide has been encountered
or is known to exist from previous drilling in the area at this depth. Maximum anticipated
bottomhole pressure will approximately equal total depth in feet multiplied by a 0.433 psi/foot
gradient, :
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10. ANTICIPATED STARTING DATE AND DURATION OF THE OPERATIONS:

It is anticipated that the drilling operations will commence the third quarter of 2009, and take
approximately seven (7) days from spud to rig release.
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NEWFIELD PRODUCTION COMPANY
STATE 6-36-8-15
SE/NW SECTION 36, T8S, RI1SE
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH
THIRTEEN POINT SURFACE PROGRAM
1. EXISTING ROADS

See attached Topographic Map “A”

To reach Newfield Production Company well location site State 6-36-8-15 located in the SE%4
NWY Section 36, T8S, R15E, S.L.B. & M., Duchesne County, Utah:

Proceed southwesterly out of Myton, Utah along Highway 40 - 1.4 miles + to the junction of this
highway and UT State Hwy 53; proceed southwesterly — 6.4 miles to it’s junction with an existing
road to the southwest; proceed southwesterly — 2.8 miles + to it’s junction with an existing road to
the south; proceed southeasterly — 0.5 miles + to it’s junction with an existing road to the south,
proceed in a southeasterly direction — 1.0 miles * to it’s junction with the beginning of the
proposed access road to the west; proceed in a southwesterly direction — 830 + to the proposed
well location.

The highways mentioned in the foregoing paragraph are bituminous surfaced roads to-the point
where Highway 216 exists to the South, thereafter the roads are constructed with existing
materials and gravel. The highways are maintained by Utah State road crews. All other roads are
maintained by County crews.

The aforementioned dirt oil field service roads and other roads in the vicinity are constructed out
of existing native materials that are prevalent to the existing area they are located in and range
from clays to a sandy-clay shale material.

The roads for access during the drilling, completion and production phase will be maintained at
the standards required by the State of Utah, or other controlling agencies. This maintenance will
consist of some minor grader work for smoothing road surfaces and for snow removal.

2. PLANNED ACCESS ROAD
Approximately 830° miles of access road is proposed. See attached Topographic Map “B”.
The proposed access road will be an 18 crown road (9’ either side of the centerline) with drainage
ditches along either side of the proposed road whether it is deemed necessary in order to handle

any run-off from normal meteorological conditions that are prevalent to this area. The maximum
grade will be less than 8%.

There will be no culverts required along this access road. There will be barrow ditches and
turnouts as needed along this road.

There are no fences encountered along this proposed road. There will be no new gates or cattle
guards required.

All construction material for this access road will be borrowed material accumulated during
construction of the access road.
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3. LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS
Refer to EXHIBIT B.
4, LOCATION OF EXISTING AND/OR PROPOSED FACILITIES

There are no existing facilities that will be used by this well.
It is anticipated that this well will be a producing oil well.

Upon construction of a tank battery, the well pad-will be surrounded by a dike of sufficient
capacity to contain at minimum 110% of the largest tank volume within the facility battery.

Tank batteries will be built to State specifications.

All permanent (on site for six (6) months or longer) structures, constructed or installed (including
pumping units), will be painted a flat, non-reflective, earth tone color to match one of the standard
environmental colors, as determined by the Rocky Mountain Five State Interagency Committee.

All facilities will be painted within six months of installation.

5. LOCATION AND TYPE OF WATER SUPPLY

Newfield Production will transport water by truck for drilling purposes from the following water
sources:

Johnson Water District
Water Right: 43-7478

Neil Moon Pond
Water Right: 43-11787

Maurice Harvey Pond
Water Right: 47-1358

Newfield Collector Well
Water Right: 41-3530 (A30414DV, contracted with the Duchesne County Conservancy District).

There will be no water well drilled at this site

6. SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

All construction material for this location shall be borrowed material accumulated during
construction of the location site and access road.

A mineral material application is not required for this location.

7. METHODS FOR HANDLING WASTE DISPOSAL

A small reserve pit (90’ x 40” x 8’ deep, or less) will be constructed from native soil and clay
materials. The reserve pit will receive the processed drill cutting (wet sand, shale & rock)
removed from the wellbore. Any drilling fluids, which do accumulate in the pit as a result of
shale-shaker carryover, cleaning of the sand trap, etc., will be promptly reclaimed. All drilling
fluids will be fresh water based, typically containing Total Dissolved Solids of less than 3000
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10.

PPM. No potassium chloride, chromates, trash, debris, nor any other substance deemed hazardous
will be placed in this pit. A 16 mil liner with felt will be required. Newfield requests approval
that a flare pit be constructed and utilized on this location.

A portable toilet will be provided for human waste.

A trash basket will be provided for garbage (trash) and hauled away to an approved disposal site at
the completion of the drilling activities.

Immediately upon first production, all produced water will be confined to a steel storage tank. If
the production water meets quality guidelines, it is transported to the Ashley, Monument Butte,
Jonah, and Beluga water injection facilities by company or contract trucks. Subsequently, the
produced water is injected into approved Class II wells to enhance Newfield's secondary recovery
project.

Water not meeting quality criteria, is disposed at Newfield's Pariette #4 disposal well (Sec. 7, T9S
R19E) or at State of Utah approved surface disposal facilities.

ANCILLARY FACILITIES:

There are no ancillary facilities planned for at the present time and none foreseen in the near
future.

WELL SITE LAYOUT:

See attached Location Layout Sheet.

Fencing Requirements

All pits will be fenced according to the following minimum standards:

a) A 39-inch net wire shall be used with at least one strand of barbed wire on top of the net.

b) The net wire shall be no more than two (2) inches above the ground. The barbed wire
shall be three (3) inches above the net wire. Total height of the fence shall be at least
forty-two (42) inches.

) Corner posts shall be centered and/or braced in such a manner to keep tight at all times

d) Standard steel, wood or pipe posts shall be used between the corner braces. Maximum

distance between any two posts shall be no greater than sixteen (16) feet.

€) All wire shall be stretched, by using a stretching device, before it is attached to the corner
posts.

The reserve pit fencing will be on three (3) sides during drilling operations and on the

fourth side when the rig moves off location. Pits will be fenced and maintained until
cleanup.

PLANS FOR RESTORATION OF SURFACE:

a) Producing Location
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12.

Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area will be cleared of
all unused tubing, equipment, debris, material, trash and junk not required for production.

The reserve pit and that portion of the location not needed for production
facilities/operations will be recontoured to the approximated natural contours. Weather
permitting, the reserve pit will be reclaimed within one hundred twenty (120) days from
the date of well completion. Before any dirt work takes place, the reserve pit must have
all fluids and hydrocarbons removed.

b) Dry Hole Abandoned Location
At such time as the-well is plugged and abandoned, the operator shall submit a
subsequent report of abandonment and the State of Utah will attach the appropriate

surface rehabilitation conditions of approval.

SURFACE OWNERSHIP: State of Utah.

OTHER ADDITIONAL INFORMATION:

Newfield Production Company requests 830’ of disturbed area be granted to allow for
construction of the proposed surface gas lines. It is proposed that the disturbed area will
temporarily be 50’ wide to allow for construction of a 10” or smaller gas gathering line, and a 3”
poly fuel gas line, with a permanent width of 30’ upon completion of the proposed gas lines. The
construction phase of the proposed gas lines will last approximately (5) days. Both lines will tie in
to the existing pipeline infrastructure. Refer to Topographic Map “C.”

Newfield Production Company requests 830° of disturbed area be granted to allow for
construction of the proposed water lines. It is proposed that the disturbed area will temporarily be
50° wide to allow for construction of a buried 3 steel water injection line and a buried 3” poly
water return line, with a permanent width of 30’ upon completion of the proposed water return
line. The construction phase of the proposed water lines will last approximately (5) days. Refer
to Topographic Map “C.” In the event that the proposed well is converted to a water injection
well, a separate injection permit will be applied for through the proper agencies.

The Archaeological Survey is attached. MOAC Report #08-301, 1/26/09. See attached report
cover page, Exhibit “D”. The Paleontological Resource Survey will be forthcoming.

a) Newfield Production Company is responsible for informing all persons in the area who
are associated with this project that they will be subject to prosecution for knowingly
disturbing historic or archaeological sites, or for collecting artifacts. If historic or
archaeological materials are uncovered during construction, Newfield is to immediately
stop work that might further disturb such materials and contact the Authorized Officer.

b) Newfield Production will control noxious weeds along rights-of-way for roads, pipelines,
well sites or other applicable facilities. On State administered land it is required that a
Pesticide Use Proposal shall be submitted and given approval prior to the application of
herbicides or other possible hazardous chemicals.

c) Drilling rigs and/or equipment used during drilling operations on this well site will not be
stacked or stored on State Lands after the conclusion of drilling operations or at any other
time without State authorization. However, if State authorization is obtained, it is only a
temporary measure to allow time to make arrangements for permanent storage on
commercial facilities.

Additional Surface Stipulations
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All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made
with all applicable laws and regulations, Onshore Oil and Gas Orders, the approved plan of
operations and any applicable Notice to Lessees. A copy of these conditions will be furnished to
the field representative to ensure compliance.

Hazardous Material Declaration

Newfield Production Company guarantees that during the drilling and completion of the State 6-
36-8-15, Newfield will not use, produce, store, transport or dispose 10,000# annually of any of the
hazardous chemicals contained in the Environmental Protection Agency’s consolidated list of
chemicals subject to reporting under Title III Superfund Amendments and Reauthorization Act
(SARA) of 1986. Newfield also guarantees that during the drilling and completion of the State 6-
36-8-15 Newfield will use, produce, store, transport or dispose less than the threshold planning
quantity (T.P.Q.) of any extremely hazardous substances as defined in 40 CFR 355.

A complete copy of the approved APD, if applicable, shall be on location during the construction
of the location and drilling activities.

Newfield Production Company or a contractor employed by Newfield Production shall contact the
State office at (801) 722-3417, 48 hours prior to construction activities.

The State office shall be notified upon site completion prior to moving on the drilling rig.

LESSEE’S OR OPERATOR’S REPRENSENTATIVE AND CERTIFICATION:

Representative

Name: Dave Allred

Address: Newfield Production Company
Route 3, Box 3630
Myton, UT 84052

Telephone: (435) 646-3721

Certification

Please be advised that Newfield Production Company is considered to be the operator of well #6-
36-8-15, SE/NW Section 36, T8S, R15E, Duchesne County, Utah and is responsible under the
terms and conditions of the lease for the operations conducted upon the leased lands. Bond
coverage is provided by Bond #B001834.

I hereby certify that the proposed drill site and access route have been inspected, and I am familiar
with the conditions which currently exist; that the statements made in this plan are true and correct
to the best of my knowledge; and that the work associated with the operations propesed here will
be performed by Newfield Production Company and its contractors and subcontractors in
conformity with this plan and the terms and conditions under which it is approved. This statement
is subject to the provisions of the 18 U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

2/27/09
Date

Mandie Crozier
Regulatory Specialist
Newfield Production Company
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T CULTURALRESOURCE INVENTORY OF : e

NEWFIELD-EXPLORATION'S FOUR BLOCK PARCELS S ——————

(T8S, RT5E, SECTIONS 25, 26, 35, AND 36) e

~ DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH R
By:

Nicole Shelnut

Prepared For:

Bureau of Land Management
Vernal Field Office
and
School & Institutional
Trust Lands Administration

Prepared Under Contract With:
Newfield Exploration Company
Rt. 3 Box 3630
Myton, UT 84052
Prepared By:
Montgomery Archaeological Consultants, Inc.

P.O. Box 219
Moab, Utah 84532

MOAC Report No. 08-301

January 26, 2009

United States Department of Interior (FLPMA)
Permit No. 08-UT-60122

State of Utah Antiquities Project (Survey)
Permit No. U-08-MQ-1227b,s



() @
State of Utah

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
MICHAELR. STYLER

JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR. | Executive Director
Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GARY R. HERBERT JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Govermor Division Director

April 27, 2009

Newfield Production Company
Rt. #3, Box 3630
Myton, UT 84052

Re: State 6-36-8-15 Well. 2099' ENL. 2053' FWL, SE NW., Sec. 36, T. 8 South, R. 15 East,
Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 ef seq., Utah |
Administrative Code R649-3-1 ef seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous
operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date. The API
identification number assigned to this well 1s 43-013-34229.

Sincerely,

A
Gil Hunt
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures
cc: Duchesne County Assessor

SITLA

UTAH

DN

o

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 « facsimile (801) 359-3940 « TTY (801) 538-7458 « www.ogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS & MINING



Operator: Newfield Production Company

Well Name & Number State 6-36-8-15

API Number: 43-013-34229

Lease: MIL-21835

Location: _SE NW Sec. 36 ’ T. 8§ South R. 15 East
Conditions of Approval

1. General

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 ef seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following
action during drilling of this well:
e 24 hours prior to cementing or testing casing — contact Dan Jarvis
e 24 hours prior to testing blowout prevention equipment — contact Dan Jarvis
e 24 hours prior to spudding the well — contact Carol Daniels
¢ Within 24 hours of any emergency changes made to the approved drilling
program — contact Dustin Doucet
e Prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well — contact Dan
Jarvis

The operator is required to get approval from the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining before
performing any of the following actions during the drilling of this well:
¢ Plugging and abandonment or significant plug back of this well — contact Dustin
Doucet
e Any changes to the approved drilling plan — contact Dustin Doucet

The following are Division of Oil, Gas and Mining contacts and their telephone numbers
(please leave a voice mail message if the person is not available to take the call):

e Dan Jarvis at: (801) 538-5338 office (801) 942-0871 home
e Carol Daniels at: = (801) 538-5284 office

¢ Dustin Doucet at: (801) 538-5281 office (801) 733-0983 home

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.



Page 2

43-013-34229
April 27, 2009

- Compliance with the State of Utah Antiquities Act forbids disturbance of archeological,

historical, or paleontological remains. Should archeological, historical or paleontological
remains be encountered during your operations, you are required to immediately suspend
all operations and immediately inform the Trust Lands Administration and the Division
of State History of the discovery of such remains.

Compliance with the Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill outlined in
the Statement of Basis. (Copy Attached)

This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns)
have not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the
“Board”). In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the
operator is requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to
analyze geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data
from surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its
analysis, and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon
which the well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate
order from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such
analysis by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.

Surface casing shall be cemented to the surface.



API Well No: 43013342290000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

ML-21835

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
GMBU (GRRV)

1. TYPE OF WELL
Oil Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
STATE 6-36-8-15

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
NEWFIELD PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43013342290000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
Rt 3 Box 3630 , Myton, UT, 84052

PHONE NUMBER:
435 646-4825 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
MONUMENT BUTTE

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
2099 FNL 2053 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: SENW Section: 36 Township: 08.0S Range: 15.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
DUCHESNE

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING
!/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: |:| CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS |:| CHANGE TUBING
4/27/2010
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT |:| DEEPEN |:| FRACTURE TREAT
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON
|:| PRODUCTION START OR RESUME |:| RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
|:| TUBING REPAIR |:| VENT OR FLARE
I:‘ DRILLING REPORT D WATER SHUTOFF D SI TA STATUS EXTENSION
Report Date:
|:| WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION |:| OTHER

CASING REPAIR

CHANGE WELL NAME

CONVERT WELL TYPE

NEW CONSTRUCTION

PLUG BACK

RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

TEMPORARY ABANDON

Ooooooooad

WATER DISPOSAL

\

APD EXTENSION

OTHER:

Newfield proposes to extend the permit to drill this well for one year.

Date:

By: \

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Approved by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

Aprill 21, 2010
TR Y |

TN

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)
Mandie Crozier

PHONE NUMBER
435 646-4825

TITLE
Regulatory Tech

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
4/21/2010

RECEIVED April 21, 2010




UTAH

DNR

-\.--/

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

OIL, GAS & MINING

Request for Permit Extension Validation Well Number 43013342290000

API: 43013342290000
Well Name: STATE 6-36-8-15
Location: 2099 FNL 2053 FWL QTR SENW SEC 36 TWNP 080S RNG 150E MER S
Company Permit Issued to: NEWFIELD PRODUCTION COMPANY
Date Original Permit Issued: 4/27/2009
The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted above, hereby verifies that

the information as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not
require revision. Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verified.

« If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface agreement been
updated? [_! Yes (® No

« Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect the spacing or
siting requirements for this location? {_! Yes (B No

» Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permitting or operation
of this proposed well? (! Yes (® No

« Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or rightof- way, which could
affect the proposed location? {_! Yes [® No

* Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? [ Yes (® No

« Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a
change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation? (_! Yes (® No

. — Approved by the
* Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? ® Yes |_! No Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

Signature: Mandie Crozier Date: 4/21/2010 )
Title: Regulatory Tech Representing: NEWFIELD PRODUCTION COMPANY Date:_ April 21, 2010

By: \

TN

RECEIVED April 21, 2010




“pu
BLM - Vernal Field Office - Notification Form

Operator Newfield Exploration Rig Name/# Ross 21 Submitted By
Adam Ferrari Phone Number 435-823-6740

Well Name/Number State 6-36-8-15

Qtr/Qtr SE/NW Section 36 Township 8S Range 15E

Lease Serial Number ML-21835

API Number 43-013-34229

Spud Notice — Spud is the initial spudding of the well, not drilling
out below a casing string.

Date/Time 12/23/2010 8:00 AM PM[ ]

Casing — Please report time casing run starts, not cementing
times.

Surface Casing

[ ] Intermediate Casing

Production Casing

Liner

Other

Date/Time 12/23/2010 2:00PM AM PM

E

BOP
| | Initial BOPE test at surface casing point

[]

BOPE test at intermediate casing point

30 day BOPE test

Other

Date/Time AM[ ] PM

Remarks




STATE OF UTAH

OPERATOR: NEWFIELD PRODUCTION CONMPANY QOPERATOR ACCT. NO, N2695
DIVISION OF OIL., GAS AND MINING ADDRESS: RT. 3 BOX 3630 .
ENTITY ACTION FORM -FORM 6 MYTON, UT 84052
I L e e Ry o R
B 99999 17400 | 4301334224 STATE 12-36-8-15 NWSW | 36 | 8S [15E |DUCHESNE| 12/29/2010 1/34,/,,?0//
WELL 1 COMMENTS: G_ /€ /e V / ’
ACTION CURRENT NEwW AP| NUMBER WELL NAME WELL LOCATION SPUD EFFECTIVE
CODE ENTITY NO. ENTITY NO. g‘; 8C T ™ RG COUNTY DATE DATE
/ N
B 99999 17400 | 4301334229 STATE 6-36-8-15 SENW | 36 | 8S [15E_|DUCHESNE| 12/23/2010 | (/2 (0/0?0//
GRRY o
Agoﬂ&N mCURREV:‘TO ’ EI\IT’IN'?YWNO AP NUMBER WELL NAME . == WELL LOCATION SDFI,\U'I% EFFECTIVE
v GREATER MON BUTTE )
B 99999 17400 | 4301334232 3-36-8-15H NENW | 36 | 8S| 15E |DUCHESNE| 12/26/2010 //a?@/ém/‘/
/ 4
ERRY B SwsO
ACTION CURRENT NEW API NUMBER WELL NAME WELL LOCATION E
CODE ENTITY NO. ENTITY NO. QQ SC RG COUNTY DATE DATE
GREATER MON BUTTE '?22 4
B 99999 17400 | 4301350213 P-26-8-16 SESE 8S| 16E |DUCHESNE| 12/30/2010 I/QM Sool/
; ) 7 7
GRRY Bl See A Swsi
ACTION CURRENT NEW AP NUMBER WELL NAME WELL LOCATION SPUD EFFECTIVE
CODE ENTITY NO. ENTITY NO. QA 8C TP RG COUNTY DATE DATE
v GREATER MON BUTTE 7 '
B 99999 17400 | 4301350214 E-35-8-16 SESE| 35| 8S| 16E |DUCHESNE| 12/29/2010 //Q?é/070 //
/ rd
GERY BHL Sea 35 MLWHW —
ACTION CURRENT NEW AP{ NUMBER WELL NAME WELL LOCATION . SPUD EFFECTIVE
CODE ENTITY NQ. ENTITY NQ, | i GQ — SC N RG COUNTY DATE DATE
3 GREATER MONBUTTE |SENE )
B 99999 17400 | 4301350235 J-25.8.16 . 1{ 25| 88| 16E |DUCHESNE| 12/29/2010 //o?@/;fo//
GRRY BHL SWSE '-—-
ACTION CODES (See Instructions on back of form)
A 100w onity for new wall (single wel] anly)
i or unit wel Jentri Park
g- H:mﬂxommﬁ:mor:mt&m HECE‘VED <t 2
D~ well from ona existing entity to & new entity
£« ther {oxplaln In comments section) JAN ] 8 20" 01/04/11

NOTE: Ute COMMENT section to explain why each Action Code was selacted,

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
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STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTAH STATE ML-21835

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly dee;

pen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged

wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME;
GMBU

I. TYPE OF WELL: 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
owweLhd  caswert[d  ormer STATE 6-36-8-15

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APINUMBER:
NEWFIELD PRODUCTION COMPANY 4301334229

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
Route 3 Box 3630 CITY Myton STATE UT zip 84052 435.646.3721 GREATER MB UNIT

4, LOCATION OF WELL;
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:

OTR/OTR. SECTION. TOWNSHIP. RANGE. MERIDIAN:

SENW, 36, T8S, R15E

COUNTY: DUCHESNE

STATE: UT

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

[J NoTICE oF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate)

Approximate date work will

[XI SUBSEOUENT REPORT
(Submit Original Form Only)

Date of Work Completion:

01/10/2011

[ acwrzz

[ auter casmv

[ casmererar

[ crance To prEVIOUS PLANS

[ cuance TusiNG

[ cHance weLL nams

[ crance weLL staTus

] cOMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS

] converr weLL TveE

[ oeeeen

[7 eracTure TREAT

] new construcTion

[] operaTor crance

[ rLuc anp aBanbon

[J rruceack

[J eropuction starTisToR)
[J recLavation oF weLL st

D RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

[ reperrORATE cuRRENT FORMATION
[] sioeTRack To REPAIR WELL

[ remporariTLy ABANDON

[ TusiNG repai

[T] venrorFLar

[] warer pisposaL

[ warer suur-orr

[x] oTHER: - spud Notice

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS, Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

On 12-23-10 Ross #29 spud and drilled 480 of 12 1/4"
1-10-11 cement w/ BJ w/ 220 sks of class G+2%kcl+.2

hole with air mist, P/U and ran 11 jts of 8 5/8" casing and set @ 468.25'. On
S#CF mixed @ 15.8ppg and 1.17 yield. Returned 5bbls to pit. WOC.

- RECEIVED
JAN 25 2011
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

TirLe_ Production Engineer

Vi
L Bl T

pate 0171372011

(This space for State use only)



NEWFIELD PRODUCTION COMPANY - CASING & CEMENT REPORT

8 5/8" CASING SET AT 468.25
LAST CASING 14 SETAT 5 OPERATOR Newfield Exploration Company
DATUM 12 WELL  STATE 6-36-8-15
DATUM TO CUT OFF CASING 12 FIELD/PROSPECT Monument Butte
DATUM TO BRADENHEAD FLANGE 12 CONTRACTOR & RIG # Ross #29
TD DRILLER 480 LOGGER
HOLE SIZE 12 1/4"
LOG OF CASING STRING:
PIECES oD ITEM - MAKE - DESCRIPTION WT/FT| GRD |THREAD| CONDT LENGTH

1 Wellhead A 1.42

11 8 5/8" |Casing (shoe jt 43.05) 24 J-55 STC A 468.25

1 8 5/8" |Guide Shoe A 0.9
CASING INVENTORY BAL. FEET JTS TOTAL LENGTH OF STRING 470.57
TOTAL LENGTH OF STRING 470.57 11 LESS CUT OFF PIECE 2
LESS NON CSG. ITEMS 2.32 PLUS DATUM TO T/CUT OFF CSG 12
PLUS FULL JTS. LEFT OUT 0 CASING SET DEPTH 480.57

TOTAL 468.25 11
TOTAL CSG. DEL. (W/O THRDS) } COMPARE
TIMING

BEGIN RUN CSG. Spud| 4:00 PM | 12/23/2010 |GOOD CIRC THRU JOB Yes
CSG. IN HOLE 6:00 PM | 12/23/2010 |Bbls CMT CIRC TO SURFACE 5
BEGIN CIRC 1:12 PM 1/10/2011 |RECIPROCATED PIPI __No
BEGIN PUMP CMT 1:23 PM 1/10/2011
BEGIN DSPL. CMT 1:39 PM 1/10/2011  |BUMPED PLUG TO 183

PLUG DOWN

1:48 PM

1/10/2011




CEMENT USED

CEMENT COMPANY- BJ

STAGE

# SX

CEMENT TYPE & ADDITIVES

1

220

Class "G"+2%CaC! Mixed @ 15.8ppg W/1.17yield Returned 5bbls to pit

CENTRALIZER & SCRATCHER PLACEMENT l

SHOW MAKE & SPACING

Middle of first, top of second and third for a total of three.

COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE Adam Ferrari

DATE

1/10/2011




Sundry Nunber: 32475 APl Well Nunber: 43013342290000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-21835
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below

current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION | 7-UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. GMBU (GRRV)
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well STATE 6-36-8-15
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
NEWFIELD PRODUCTION COMPANY 43013342290000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
Rt 3 Box 3630 , Myton, UT, 84052 435 646-4825 Ext MONUMENT BUTTE
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
2099 FNL 2053 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: SENW Section: 36 Township: 08.0S Range: 15.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
] NOTICE OF INTENT [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON |:| PLUG BACK
|:| SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE |:| WATER DISPOSAL
J DRILLING REPORT D D |:|
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER: IOperations Suspended I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
The above well has remained in suspended operations status from Accepted by the

February 2011 through November 2012. Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
November 27, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Jennifer Peatross 435 646-4885 Production Technician
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 11/27/2012

RECEI VED: Nov. 27, 2012




State of Utah

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
MICHAEL R. STYLER

GARY R. HERBERT Executive Director
Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
SPENCER J. COX JOHN R.BAZA
Lieutenant Governor Division Director
August 21, 2014
CERTIFIED MAIL NO.: 7011 2976 0001 8828 1559
| A2, O3 24224
Mr. Kirby Carroll L, \'C V-
Newfield Production Company St L2 5-15
1001 17™ Street, STE 2000 2, %<5 ISE
Denver, CO 80202

Subject: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned Well Requirements for Fee or State L.eases

Dear Mr. Carroll:

As of April 2014, Newfield Production Company (Newfield) has eighteen (18) State
Lease Wells and three (3) Fee Lease Wells (see attachment A) that are currently in non-
compliance with the requirements for extended shut-in or temporarily abandoned (SI/TA) status.
Fifteen (15) wells were added to Newfield’s SI/TA list in 2014.

Six (6) of these wells (attachment A) have previously been issued notices of non-
compliance and were later granted extensions which have since expired in August, 2013. Five
(5) of these wells (attachment A) have been shut-in beyond five (5) years and are cause for
concern due to possible surface issues. The Gulf State wells were inspected by the Division and
the State of Utah School & Institutional Trust Lands Administration (SITLA) recently showing
multiple issues on site. These wells need to be addressed immediately and comply with rule
R649-3-36-1.3.3 concerning the length of time SI/TA.

The State 16-2 well has known surface issues. It has been shut-in for over 50 years. The
Division had previously granted SI/TA extension for the State 16-2 based on well integrity and
under the intention of waiting for water flood expansion. The area was drilled for 20 acre wells
in early 2013; therefore the reason for the State 16-2 remaining shut-in is no longer valid.

Wells SI/TA beyond twelve (12) consecutive months requires filing a Sundry Notice
(R649-3-36-1). Wells with five (5) years non-activity or non-productivity shall be plugged,
unless the Division grants approval for extended shut-in time upon a showing of good cause by
the operator (649-3-36-1.3.3). For extended SI/TA consideration the operator shall provide the
Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining with the following:

1. Reasons for SI/TA of the well (R649-3-36-1.1)

UTAH

2. The length of time the well is expected to be SUTA (R649-3-36-1.2), and DNR
M

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 » facsimile (801) 359-3940 « TTY (801) 538-7458 » www.ogm.utah.gov

OIL, GAS & MINING
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Newfield Production Company
August 21, 2014

An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well has
integrity, meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition, static fluid level,
pressure, existence or absence of Underground Sources of Drinking Water and
other factors do not make the well a risk to public health and safety or the
environment (R649-3-36-1.3).

Please note that the Divisions preferred method for showing well integrity is by MIT

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity and may help
qualify your well for extended SI/TA. Note: As of July 1, 2003, wells in violation of the SI/TA
rule R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-1-4.2, 4.3).

1.
2.
3.

4.
5.

Wellbore diagram, and

Copy of recent casing pressure test, and

Current pressures on the wellbore (tubing pressure, casing pressure, and
casing/casing annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity, and
Fluid level in the wellbore, and

An explanation of how the submitted information proves integrity.

If the required information is not received within 30 days of the date of this notice, further

actions may be initiated. If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me at
(801) 538-5281.

DKD/IP/js

@mly’ @«UL

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

cc:  Compliance File

Well File

LaVonne Garrison, SITLA

N:A\O&G Reviewed Docs\ChronFile\PetroleumEngineer\SITA



ATTACHMENT A

Well Name API LEASE Years inactive Prior Notice
1 [STATE 16-2 43-013-30552 ML-34538 | TILE e 2™ NOTICE
2 [SUNDANCE 16-32-8-18 43-047-34466 ML-22058  [TEEIERARUES| 2™ NOTICE
3 |GULF STATE 36-22 43-047-31892 ML-22057 ears 3 months AN OIS =
4 |GULF STATE 36-13 43-047-31345 ML-22057 6 years 6 months|RAENII[8=
5 |GULF STATE 36-12 43-047-31864 ML-22057 5 years 3 months] IRMENCIS=
6 [NGC ST 33-32 43-047-31116 ML-22058 2 years 5 month 15T NOTICE
7 |ASHLEY ST 12-2-9-15 43-013-32576 ML-43538 1 year 5 months
8 |ODEKIRK SPRING 4-36-8-17 | 43-047-32764 ML-44305 1 year 6 months
9 |GMBU G-32-8-16 43-013-50835 ML-21836 2 years 8 months
10HANCOCK 11-23-4-1 43-047-33081 FEE 1 year 3 months
11MOON 3-20-4-2 43-013-50007 FEE 1 year 1 month
12|S MON BUTTE ST P-2-9-16 | 43-013-50118 ML-21839 1 year 9 months
13|STATE 2-2-9-18 43-047-35774 ML-48377 2 years 2 months
14/STATE 3-16-9-18 43-047-35813 ML-48378 1 year 1 month
15|STATE 5-2-9-18 43-047-35777 ML-48377 1 year 2 months
16{STATE 5-36-8-15 43-013-34230 ML-21835 1 year 11 months
17|STATE 6-36-8-15 43-013-34229 ML-21835 3 years 3 months
18|STATE 7-2-9-18 43-047-35787 ML-48377 1 year 5 months
19[TERRY-PREWITT 11-19-4-1 | 43-013-50074 FEE 2 years 2 months
20|WELLS DRAW 4-32-8-16 43-013-32222 ML-21836 1 year 2 months
21|WELLS DRAW ST 7-36 43-013-30934 ML-21835 1 year




Sundry Nunber: 59056 APl Well Nunber: 43013342290000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

ML-21835

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
GMBU (GRRV)

1. TYPE OF WELL
Oil Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
STATE 6-36-8-15

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
NEWFIELD PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43013342290000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER:

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:

Rt 3 Box 3630 , Myton, UT, 84052 435 646-4825 Ext MONUMENT BUTTE
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
2099 FNL 2053 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: SENW Section: 36 Township: 08.0S Range: 15.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

l:‘ ACIDIZE

l:‘ CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS

l:‘ ALTER CASING
J NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: D CHANGE TUBING

12/17/2014
l:‘ CHANGE WELL STATUS l:‘ COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS
l:‘ SUBSEQUENT REPORT l:‘ DEEPEN l:‘ FRACTURE TREAT
Date of Work Completion:
l:‘ OPERATOR CHANGE J PLUG AND ABANDON

l:‘ l:‘ PRODUCTION START OR RESUME l:‘ RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE
SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: l:‘

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION l:‘ SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

l:‘ TUBING REPAIR l:‘ VENT OR FLARE

l:‘ SI TA STATUS EXTENSION

l:‘ OTHER

l:‘ DRILLING REPORT l:‘ WATER SHUTOFF

Report Date:

l:‘ WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION

|:| CASING REPAIR

D CHANGE WELL NAME

|:| CONVERT WELL TYPE

|:| NEW CONSTRUCTION

D PLUG BACK

|:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
|:| TEMPORARY ABANDON

D WATER DISPOSAL

|:| APD EXTENSION

OTHER: I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Newfield proposes to Plug and Abandon this above
mentioned well. See attached proposed Plug and Abandon
Procedure.

Date:

Approved by the
Utah Division of
0il, Gas and Mining

January 07, 2015

By: (\;\b‘/\ (L DM*«??('

Please Review Attached Conditions of Approval

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)
Mandie Crozier

PHONE NUMBER
435 646-4825

TITLE
Regulatory Tech

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
12/17/2014

RECEI VED: Dec.

17, 2014



Sundry Nunber: 59056 APl Well Nunber: 43013342290000

UTAH

DNR

.-A*....f

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

OIL, GAS & MINING

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43013342290000

1. Notify the Division at least 24 hours prior to conducting abandonment operations. Please call
Dan Jarvis at 801-538-5338.

2. Add Plug #1: A 100’ plug (12 sx) shall be balanced from +3885’ to 3785’. This will isolate the
top of the waterflood interval and hydrocarbons from waters uphole.

3. All balanced plugs shall be tagged to ensure that they are at the depth specified.
4. All annuli shall be cemented from a minimum depth of 100’ to the surface.

5. The interval between plugs shall be filled with noncorrosive fluid of adequate density to
prevent migration of formation water into or through the well bore (R649-3-24-3.5).

6. Surface reclamation shall be done in accordance with R649-3-34 — Well Site Restoration.
7. All requirements in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-24 shall apply.

8. If there are any changes to the procedure or the wellbore configuration, notify Dustin Doucet
at 801-538-5281 (ofc) or 801-733-0983 (home) prior to continuing with the procedure.

9. All other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules
shall apply.

RECEI VED: Jan. 07, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 59056 APl Well Nunber: 43013342290000

12/24/2014 Wellbore Diagram 1263
API Well No 43-013-34229-00-00 Permit No: Well Name/No: STATE 6-36-8-15
Company Name: NEWFIELD PRODUCTION COMPANY
Location: Sec: 36 T:8S R: 15E Spot: SENW String Information
Coordinates: X: 569693 Y: 4436506 . Bottom Diameter Weight Length s _
. String (gt sub) (inches) (Ib/ft) (f) ¢ &
Field Name: MONUMENT BUTTE HOL1 468 12.25
County Name: DUCHESNE SURF 468 8.625 24
HOL2 6355 7.875
PROD 6355 55 15.5 (’0_ (B3¢ 3 \;7 Y%=z
unrs el S FEC =)
Cement from 468 ft. to surface
| Surface: 8.625 in. @ 468 ft. ;’ /t,L L
BMSW H 5D - ‘ Hole: 12.25 in. @ 468 fi. —_—

e —

S00’ (sTexY1.is )(7 qga)( 9'0-7 T

~oc. @ SFC ‘/ak

Cement Information

GARRAYV (%5 BOC  TOC
String (ft sub) (ft sub) Class Sacks
PROD 6355 46 50 400
PROD 6355 46 LT 300
SURF 468 0 G 220
| 2735

CARGL 28354 Y ||

2885 , Perforation Information
@ 4&& P/ﬂ.ﬁj i# /
= Wﬂm/ Qfxw/—ec% e C/‘H?GL //U(L/td\ﬂ &‘mg,
PRI A0 /0@/(/ s X6-1330 ) # U2 sx
K-faa (2 285

CSLPK. L3804 Formation Information
Formation Depth
UNTA 0
BMSW 450

GRRV 1585

GARGL 3835

DGCRK 4870

Cement from 6355 ft. to 46 fi.
) . CSLPK 5780
WST'C/ Q 3)91 =3 Production: 5.5 in. @ 6355 ft. WSTC 6315

| Hole: 7.875 in. @ 6355 ft.

TD: 6355 TVD: PBTD:

Page 1



Sundry Nunber :

59056 API

Vel | Nunber:

43013342290000

NEWFIELD PRODUCTION COMPANY

State 6-36-8-15

Plug & Abandonment Procedure

DOWNHOLE DATA

Elevation:

5761’ GL,; 5773’ RKB

TD:

6355’

Surface casing:

8-5/8" J55 24# @ 476’
cmt w/220 sx

Circ. To surf.

Production casing:

5-1/2” J55 15.5# @ 6406’
cmt w/300 sxs prem. lite and

ID: 4.9507; Drift: 4.825”
TOC @ 46°

400 sxs 50/50 poz
PBTD: N/A
Tubing: N/A
Existing Perfs: N/A

Notes:

No cased hole probs noted

PROCEDURE

1. Notify BLM or Utah DOGM as necessary prior to P&A. Dig, line, and fence pit as necessary
for cement wash up and returns.

2. MIRU SU. ND WH and NU BOP.

3. RIH w/ thg to 500’ and establish circulation. RU cementing company.

4. Plug #1: Mix and pump a total of 59 sxs Class G neat cement or equivalent (67.9 ft"3) cement

from 500 up to surface.

5. POOH w/ tbg and top off cement.

6. ND BOP and NU tubing head adapter or other w/ valve.

7. RDMO cementing company and rig.

8. MI welder and cut off 5-1/2” and 8-5/8" casing below grade and weld on P&A marker.

RECEI VED: Dec.

17, 2014



Sundry Nunber: 59056 APl Well Nunber: 43013342290000

State 6-36-8-15
Spud Date: 1/13/2011

Put on Production: N/A Wellbore Diagram
GL:5761" KB:5779’

SURFACE CASING FRAC JOB
CSG SIZE: 8-5/8” Cement top @ 46"
GRADE: J-55 | -
WEIGHT: 24#

LENGTH: 11 jts (468’)

DEPTH LANDED: 526" KB

HOLE SIZE: 12-1/4”

CEMENT DATA: 220 sx class ‘G’ cmt

End of Surface
Casing: 468’

| g
|

Plug #1: 500
up to surface

PRODUCTION CASING

CSG SIZE: 5-1/2"

GRADE: J-55

WEIGHT: 15.5#

LENGTH: 150 jts (6352")

HOLE SIZE: 7-7/8”

TOTAL DEPTH: 6355

CEMENT DATA: 300 sx Prem. Lite and 400 sx 50/50 poz
CEMENT TOP AT: 46’

NEWFIELD

State 6-36-8-15
2099’ FNL & 2053’ FWL SE/NW
Section 36-T8S-R15E
Duchesne Co, Utah
API # 43-013-34229; Lease # ML-21835

TD @ 6355’

RECEI VED: Dec. 17, 2014



Sundry Nunber: 59576 APl Well Nunber: 43013342290000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-21835

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
GMBU (GRRV)

1. TYPE OF WELL
Oil Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
STATE 6-36-8-15

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
NEWFIELD PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43013342290000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:

Rt 3 Box 3630 , Myton, UT, 84052 435 646-4825 Ext MONUMENT BUTTE
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
2099 FNL 2053 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: SENW Section: 36 Township: 08.0S Range: 15.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

l:‘ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

J SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

1/6/2015

l:‘ SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

l:‘ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

l:‘ ACIDIZE

l:‘ CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS

l:‘ CHANGE WELL STATUS

l:‘ DEEPEN

l:‘ OPERATOR CHANGE

l:‘ PRODUCTION START OR RESUME

l:‘ REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
l:‘ TUBING REPAIR

l:‘ WATER SHUTOFF

l:‘ WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION

l:‘ ALTER CASING

I:‘ CHANGE TUBING

l:‘ COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS
l:‘ FRACTURE TREAT

I:‘ PLUG AND ABANDON

l:‘ RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE

l:‘ SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

I:‘ VENT OR FLARE

l:‘ SI TA STATUS EXTENSION

J OTHER

|:| CASING REPAIR

D CHANGE WELL NAME

|:| CONVERT WELL TYPE

|:| NEW CONSTRUCTION

D PLUG BACK

|:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
|:| TEMPORARY ABANDON

D WATER DISPOSAL

|:| APD EXTENSION

OTHER: IDriIIing Report

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
The Daily Drilling Reports as well as Surface and Production Casing
Reports were never submitted for this well that was originally drilled in

2011. See Attached Reports.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY

February 03, 2015

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)
Mandie Crozier

PHONE NUMBER

435 646-4825

TITLE
Regulatory Tech

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
1/6/2015

RECEI VED: Jan.

06, 2015



Sundry

Nunber :

NEWFIELD

59576 API

Vel | Nunber:

Daily Drilling Report

ROCKY MOUNTAINS

43013342290000

Well Name:
Report Date:

Present Ops:

STATE 6-36-8-15

1/13/2011

Waiting on Cement

Field: GMBU CTB1 Rig Name: Ross #29 Report No: SPUD 1
Location: S36 T8S R15E KB: 12 Since Spud:

County: DUCHESNE Supervisor: Adam Ferrari AFE No: 19568
State: uT Supervisor 2: Daily Cost: 71,156
Elevation: 5761 Rig Phone: 435- 823-6740 Cum. Cost: 71,156
Formation: UINTAH Rig Email: aferrari@newfield.com Rig Release Date 01/19/11

Depth (MD): 480" PTD (MD): 480" Daily Footage: Avg ROP:
Depth (TVD): 480" PTD (TVD): 480" Drilling Hours: Exp TD Date:
Casing Data:
Type Size Weight Grade Connection Top Bottom Shoe Test
Conductor 14 o' 5'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 J-55 STC 0' 481"
Mud Properties: Drilling Parameters: BHA:
Type: Air/Mist WOB: Component Length ID oD
Weight: Tot RPM:
Vis: Torque:
PV: P/U Wt:
YP: Rot Wit:
10s Gels: S/O Wit:
10m Gels: Max Pull:
pH: Avg Gas:
API Filtrate: Max Gas:
HPHT Filtrate: Cnx Gas:
Cake: Trip Gas:
Oil/H,0O Ratio:
ES: Surveys:
MBT: Depth Inc Azi
Pm:
Pf/Mf: /
% Solids: Total Length: 0.00
% LGS:
% Sand: Hydraulics:
LCM (ppb): PP: HHP/in®: AV DP/DC:
Calcium: GPM: %P @ bit: SPR #1:
Chlorides: TFA: Jet Vel: SPR #2:
Bit Info:
Bit # Size Make Type SIN Jets In Out Footage Hrs ROP Grade
Activity Summary (6:00am - 6:00am)
From To Hours| P /U [Summary
On 12-23-10 Ross # 29 spud and drilled 480 of 12 1/4" hole, P/U and run 11 jts. Of 8 5/8" casing set
@ 468.25'. On 1-10-11 cement w/ BJ w/ 220 sks of class G+2%kcl+.25#CF mixed @ 15.8ppg and 1.17
yield. Returned 5bbls to pit, bump plug to 183 psi, BLM and State were notified of spud via email.

24 Hour Activity Summary:

On 12-23-10 Ross #29 spud and drilled 480 of 12 1/4" hole, P/U and run 11 jts of 8 5/8" casing set @ 468.25', On 1-10-11 cement w/ BJ w/ 220 sks of
class G+2%kcl+.25#CF mixed @ 15.8ppg and 1.17 yield. Returned 5bbls to pit

24 Hour Plan Forward:

Wait on NDSI #3

Safety Weather Fuel
Last BOP Test: BOP Drill? High / Low 0/-20 Diesel Used:
BOP Test Press: Function Test? Conditions: clear Diesel Recvd: 0
Newfield Pers. 1 Incident None Wind: calm Diesel on Loc: 0
Contract Pers. 6

RECEI VED. Jan. 06, 2015




Sundry Nunber: 59576 APl Well Nunber: 43013342290000
NEWFIELD Well Name: STATE 6-36-8-15
Da||y Dr||||ng Report Report Date: 1/14/2011
ROCKY MOUNTAINS Present Ops: Rigging down
Field: GMBU CTB1 Rig Name: NDSI #3 Report No: MOB 1
Location: S36 T8S R15E KB: 12 Since Spud: 0
County: DUCHESNE Supervisor: Johnny Davis 435-823-3612 AFE No: 19568
State: uT Supervisor 2: Daily Cost: 4,060
Elevation: 5761 Rig Phone: Cum. Cost: 75,216
Formation: UINTAH Rig Email: Rig Release Date 01/19/11
Depth (MD): 480' PTD (MD): 6,320' Daily Footage: 0' Avg ROP:
Depth (TVD): 480 PTD (TVD): 6,320 Drilling Hours: 0.0 Exp TD Date:
Casing Data:
Type Size Weight Grade Connection Top Bottom Shoe Test
Conductor 14 5'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 J-55 STC 481"
Mud Properties: Drilling Parameters: BHA:
Type: WOB: Component Length ID oD
Weight: Tot RPM:
Vis: Torque:
PV: P/U Wt:
YP: Rot Wit:
10s Gels: S/O Wt:
10m Gels: Max Pull:
pH: Avg Gas:
API Filtrate: Max Gas:
HPHT Filtrate: Cnx Gas:
Cake: Trip Gas:
Qil/H,0 Ratio:
ES: Surveys:
MBT: Depth Inc Azi
Pm:
Pf/Mf: /
% Solids: Total Length: 0.00
% LGS:
% Sand: Hydraulics:
LCM (ppb): PP: HHP/in*: AV DP/DC:
Calcium: GPM: %P @ bit: SPR #1:
Chlorides: TFA: Jet Vel: SPR #2:
Bit Info:
Bit # Size Make Type SIN Jets In Out Footage Hrs ROP Grade
Activity Summary (6:00am - 6:00am)
From To Hours| P/U |Summary
23:00 6:00 7.0 P RD to move rig # 3 from Federal 13-25-8-15 to State 6-36-8-15
24 Hour Activity Summary:
RD to move rig # 3 from Federal 13-25-8-15 to State 6-36-8-15
24 Hour Plan Forward:
Move rig to State 6-36-8-15 /RU /Pressure test/PU BHA /Drill
Safety Weather Fuel
Last BOP Test: BOP Drill? no High / Low 17/-5 Diesel Used: 0
BOP Test Press: Function Test? No Conditions: Clear Diesel Recvd: 0
Newfield Pers. 6 Incidents? None Wind: Calm Diesel on Loc: 2,450
Contract Pers. 0
RECEI VED: Jan. 06, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 59576 APl Well Nunber: 43013342290000

NEWFIELD Well Name: STATE 6-36-8-15
. Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 1/15/2011

ROCKY MOUNTAINS Present Ops: Drill 7 7/8" hole with fresh water
Field: GMBU CTB1 Rig Name: NDSI #3 Report No: Daily 1
Location: S36 T8S R15E KB: 12 Since Spud: 1
County: DUCHESNE Supervisor: Johnny Davis 435-823-3612 AFE No: 19568
State: uT Supervisor 2: Daily Cost: 65,547
Elevation: 5761 Rig Phone: Cum. Cost: 140,763
Formation: UINTAH Rig Email: Rig Release Date 01/19/11
Depth (MD): 1,190' PTD (MD): 6,320' Daily Footage: 710' Avg ROP: 101.4
Depth (TVD): 1,190 PTD (TVD): 6,320 Drilling Hours: 7.0 Exp TD Date: 1/17/2011
Casing Data:
Type Size Weight Grade Connection Top Bottom Shoe Test
Conductor 14 5'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 J-55 STC 481"
Mud Properties: Drilling Parameters: BHA:
Type: Fresh water WOB: 18 Component Length ID oD
Weight: 8.5 Tot RPM: 65 Smith MI616 PDC Bit 1.00'
Vis: 31 Torque: Hunting .33 Mud Motor 34.79'
PV: P/U Wt: XO 3.03'
YP: Rot Wit: Monel 30.82
10s Gels: S/O Wt: Gap sub 3.34'
10m Gels: Max Pull: Index 1.84'
pH: Avg Gas: XO 2.98'
API Filtrate: Max Gas: 17 6" DC's 495.53'
HPHT Filtrate: Cnx Gas:
Cake: Trip Gas:
Qil/H,0 Ratio:
ES: Surveys:
MBT: Depth Inc Azi
Pm: 512' 0.53° 6.77°
Pf/Mf: / 795' 0.44° 26.01°
% Solids: 955' 0.79° 36.56° Total Length: 573.33
% LGS:
% Sand: Hydraulics:
LCM (ppb): PP: 800 HHP/in*: AV DP/DC: | MD 80 pump
Calcium: GPM: 420 %P @ bit: SPR #1:
Chlorides: TFA: Jet Vel: SPR #2:
Bit Info:

Bit # Size Make Type SIN Jets In Out Footage Hrs ROP Grade

1 77/8" Smith MI616 6/16 438' 752' 7.0 107.4

Activity Summary (6:00am - 6:00am)

From To Hours| P/U |Summary
6:00 14:00 8.0 P |On 1/14/11 Jones Trucking moved Rig # 3 from Federal 13-25-8-15 to State 6-36-8-15/Set all Equipment
14:00 17:30 3.5 P RU Quick test/Test Kelly,Safety Valve,Pipe & Blind rams & Choke to 2000 psi for10 min./All OK/

Test Casing to 1500 psi for 30 min./OK

17:30 20:00 2.5 P PU BHA with Pay Zone Directional tools/ Tag Cmt. @ 438’

20:00 21:30 15 P |Drill 7 7/8" hole from 438" to 530'/WOB 12/RPM 65/GPM 420/ROP 61 FPH
21:30 22:30 1.0 U |Work on Pason pressure sensor

22:30 23:30 1.0 P |Drill 7 7/8" hole from 530' to 614' /WOB 18/RPM 65/GPM 420/ROP 84 FPH
23:30 0:00 0.5 P Install rotating head rubber and Drive bushings.

0:00 1:00 1.0 P |Drill 7 7/8" hole from 614' to 708'/WOB 18/RPM 65/ GPM 420/ROP 94 FPH
1:00 2:00 1.0 U |Thawlines to Yellow dog pump

2:00 6:00 4.0 P |Drill 7 7/8" hole from 708' to 1190/WOB 18/RPM 65/GPM 420/ROP121 FPH

24 Hour Activity Summary:
On 1/14/11 Jones Trucking moved rig from Fed. 13-25-8-15 to State 6-36-8-15/Set equip./Quick test tested BOP's to 2000 psi for 10 min. & Csg. To
1500 psi for 30 min./All tested good/Changed 1 door gasket./PU BHA /tag @ 438'/Drill 7 7/8" to 1190 /WOB 18/

24 Hour Plan Forward:

Drill

Safety Weather Fuel

Last BOP Test: 1/14/2011 BOP Drill? yes High / Low 17/1 Diesel Used: 1,000
BOP Test Press: 2000 Function Test? Yes Conditions: Clear Diesel Recvd: 7,000
Newfield Pers. 11 Incidents? None Wind: calm Diesel on Loc: 8,930
Contract Pers. 17

RECEI VED: Jan. 06, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 59576 APl Well Nunber: 43013342290000

NEWFIELD Well Name: STATE 6-36-8-15
. Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 1/16/2011

ROCKY MOUNTAINS Present Ops: Drill 7 7/8" hole with fresh water
Field: GMBU CTB1 Rig Name: NDSI #3 Report No: Daily 2
Location: S36 T8S R15E KB: 12 Since Spud: 2
County: DUCHESNE Supervisor: Johnny Davis 435-823-3612 AFE No: 19568
State: uT Supervisor 2: Daily Cost: 36,526
Elevation: 5761 Rig Phone: Cum. Cost: 177,289
Formation: GREEN RIVER Rig Email: Rig Release Date 01/19/11
Depth (MD): 3,229 PTD (MD): 6,320' Daily Footage: 2,039 Avg ROP: 86.8
Depth (TVD): 3,229' PTD (TVD): 6,320 Drilling Hours: 23.5 Exp TD Date: 1/17/2011
Casing Data:
Type Size Weight Grade Connection Top Bottom Shoe Test
Conductor 14 5'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 J-55 STC 481"
Mud Properties: Drilling Parameters: BHA:
Type: Fresh water WOB: 18 Component Length ID oD
Weight: 8.5 Tot RPM: 67 Smith MI1616 PDC Bit 1.00'
Vis: 31 Torque: Hunting .33 Mud Motor 34.79'
PV: P/U Wt: 109,000 XO 3.03'
YP: Rot Wit: Monel 30.82
10s Gels: S/O Wt: Gap sub 3.34'
10m Gels: Max Pull: Index 1.84'
pH: Avg Gas: XO 2.98'
API Filtrate: Max Gas: 17 6" DC's 495.53'
HPHT Filtrate: Cnx Gas:
Cake: Trip Gas:
Qil/H,0 Ratio:
ES: Surveys:
MBT: Depth Inc Azi
Pm: 512' 0.53° 6.77°
Pf/Mf: / 795' 0.44° 26.01°
% Solids: 955' 0.79° 36.56° Total Length: 573.33
% LGS: 1,613 0.66° 21.71°
% Sand: 2,434’ 0.88° 244.07° Hydraulics:
LCM (ppb): 2,684' 1.41° 217.92° PP: 1220 HHP/in*: AV DP/DC: | MD80 pump
Calcium: 3,061' 2.24° 232.51° GPM: 420 %P @ bit: SPR#1: f0opsi@ 92sp
Chlorides: TFA: Jet Vel: SPR #2:
Bit Info:

Bit # Size Make Type SIN Jets In Out Footage Hrs ROP Grade

1 77/8" Smith MI616 6/16 438' 2,791' 30.5 91.5

Activity Summary (6:00am - 6:00am)

From To Hours| P/U |Summary

6:00 16:30 10.5 P |Drill 7 7/8" hole from 1240' to 2189/WOB 18/RPM 67/GPM 420/ROP 90 FPH

16:30 17:00 0.5 P Rig service/Function test BOP's & Crown-O-Matic/OK

17:00 6:00 13.0 P |Drill 7 7/8" hole from 2189' to 3229/WOB 18/RPM 67/GPM 420/ROP 80FPH
No Slides

24 Hour Activity Summary:
Drill 7 7/8" hole from 1240' to 3229'/WOB 18/RPM 67/GPM 420/ROP 85 FPH/H2S 0 PPM/Flow 0 GPM/Last survey @ 3061’ 2.24° Dir. 232.51

24 Hour Plan Forward:

Drill

Safety Weather Fuel

Last BOP Test: 1/14/2011 BOP Drill? yes High / Low 11/-5 Diesel Used: 649
BOP Test Press: 2000 Function Test? Yes Conditions: Cloudy Diesel Recvd: 0
Newfield Pers. 9 Incidents? None Wind: Calm Diesel on Loc: 8,281
Contract Pers. 4

RECEI VED: Jan. 06, 2015



Sundry Nunber :

NEWFIELD

59576 API

Vel | Nunber:

Daily Drilling Report

ROCKY MOUNTAINS

43013342290000
Well Name: STATE 6-36-8-15
Report Date: 1/17/2011

Present Ops:

Drill 7 7/8" hole with fresh water

Field: GMBU CTB1 Rig Name: NDSI #3 Report No: Daily 3
Location: S36 T8S R15E KB: 12 Since Spud: 3
County: DUCHESNE Supervisor: Xabier Lasa 435-823-6014 AFE No: 19568
State: uT Supervisor 2: Daily Cost: 15,785
Elevation: 5761 Rig Phone: Cum. Cost: 193,074
Formation: GREEN RIVER Rig Email: Rig Release Date 01/19/11
Depth (MD): 6,320' PTD (MD): 6,320' Daily Footage: 3,091 Avg ROP: 131.5
Depth (TVD): 6,320 PTD (TVD): 6,320 Drilling Hours: 23.5 Exp TD Date: 1/17/2011
Casing Data:
Type Size Weight Grade Connection Top Bottom Shoe Test
Conductor 14 5'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 J-55 STC 481"
Mud Properties: Drilling Parameters: BHA:
Type: Fresh water WOB: 20,000 Component Length ID oD
Weight: 8.5 Tot RPM: 175 Smith MI1616 PDC Bit 1.00'
Vis: 31 Torque: Hunting .33 Mud Motor 34.79'
PV: P/U Wt: XO 3.03'
YP: Rot Wit: Monel 30.82
10s Gels: S/O Wt: Gap sub 3.34'
10m Gels: Max Pull: Index 1.84'
pH: Avg Gas: XO 2.98'
API Filtrate: Max Gas: 17 6" DC's 495.53'
HPHT Filtrate: Cnx Gas:
Cake: Trip Gas:
Qil/H,0 Ratio:
ES: Surveys:
MBT: Depth Inc Azi
Pm: 1,613 0.66° 21.71°
Pf/Mf: / 2,434 0.88° 244.07°
% Solids: 2,684’ 1.41° 217.92° Total Length: 573.33
% LGS: 3,061 2.24° 232.51°
% Sand: 3,504' 2.540 239.31° Hydraulics:
LCM (ppb): 3,946' 2.420 230.67° PP: 1350  |HHP/in®: AV DP/DC:
Calcium: 4,295' 2.46° 226.27° GPM: 405 %P @ bit: SPR #1: 90-630
Chlorides: 4,668' 2.29° 219.42° TFA: Jet Vel: SPR #2:
Bit Info:
Bit # Size Make Type SIN Jets In Out Footage Hrs ROP Grade

1 77/8" Smith MI616 JE2564 6/16 438' 4,492 54.0 83.2
Activity Summary (6:00am - 6:00am)

From To Hours| P/U |Summary

6:00 14:00 8.0 P |Drill 7 7/8" hole F/ 3229' to 3828" w/ 20K WOB, TRPM-175,GPM-410,Avg ROP-75 ft/hr

14:00 14:30 0.5 P Rig Service, check crownomatic and BOP , check flow=no flow

14:30 6:00 15.5 P |Drill 7 7/8" hole F/ 3828' to 4930" w/ 20K WOB, TRPM-175,GPM-405,Avg ROP-71 ft/hr

No H2S or flow in last 24 hours

24 Hour Activity Summary:

Drill 7 7/8" hole F/ 3229' to 3828' w/ 20K WOB,TRPM-175,GPM-410,Avg ROP-75 ft/hr, Rig Service, check crownomatic and BOP , check flow=no
flow, Drill 7 7/8" hole F/ 3828' to 4930' w/ 20K WOB, TRPM-175,GPM-405,Avg ROP-71 ft/hr,No H2S or flow in last 24 hours

24 Hour Plan Forward:

Drill ahead toward TD.

Safety Weather Fuel
Last BOP Test: 1/14/2011 BOP Drill? yes High / Low 15/-5 Diesel Used: 1,471
BOP Test Press: 2000 Function Test? Yes Conditions: clear Diesel Recvd: 0
Newfield Pers. 9 Incidents? None Wind: calm Diesel on Loc: 6,810
Contract Pers. 2

RECEI VED. Jan. 06, 2015




Sundry Nunber :
NEWFIELD

59576 API

Vel |

Nunber :

Daily Drilling Report

ROCKY MOUNTAINS

43013342290000

Well Name:

STATE 6-36-8-15

Report Date:

1/18/2011

Present Ops:

Lay Down Drill Pipe/BHA

Field: GMBU CTB1 Rig Name: NDSI #3 Report No: Daily 4
Location: S36 T8S R15E KB: 12 Since Spud: 4
County: DUCHESNE Supervisor: Xabier Lasa 435-823-6014 AFE No: 19568
State: uT Supervisor 2: Daily Cost: 17,685
Elevation: 5761 Rig Phone: Cum. Cost: 210,759
Formation: GREEN RIVER Rig Email: Rig Release Date 01/19/11
Depth (MD): 6,355' PTD (MD): 6,320' Daily Footage: 35' Avg ROP: 1.9
Depth (TVD): 6,355 PTD (TVD): 6,320 Drilling Hours: 18.0 Exp TD Date: 1/17/2011
Casing Data:
Type Size Weight Grade Connection Top Bottom Shoe Test
Conductor 14 5'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 J-55 STC 481"
Mud Properties: Drilling Parameters: BHA:
Type: Fresh water WOB: 20,000 Component Length ID oD
Weight: 8.5 Tot RPM: 170 Smith MI1616 PDC Bit 1.00'
Vis: 31 Torque: Hunting .33 Mud Motor 34.79'
PV: P/U Wt: XO 3.03'
YP: Rot Wit: Monel 30.82
10s Gels: S/O Wt: Gap sub 3.34'
10m Gels: Max Pull: Index 1.84'
pH: Avg Gas: XO 2.98'
API Filtrate: Max Gas: 17 6" DC's 495.53'
HPHT Filtrate: Cnx Gas:
Cake: Trip Gas:
Qil/H,0 Ratio:
ES: Surveys:
MBT: Depth Inc Azi
Pm: 3,504' 2.54° 239.31°
Pf/Mf: / 3,946' 2.42° 230.67°
% Solids: 4,295' 2.46° 226.27° Total Length: 573.33
% LGS: 4,668' 2.29° 219.42°
% Sand: 5,017' 2.37° 210.19° Hydraulics:
LCM (ppb): 5,490' 2.420 197.01° PP: 1500  |HHP/in®: AV DP/DC:
Calcium: 6,028' 2.50° 209.93° GPM: 400 %P @ bit: SPR #1: 90-630
Chlorides: 6,355' 1.89° 209.09° TFA: Jet Vel: SPR #2:
Bit Info:
Bit # Size Make Type SIN Jets In Out Footage Hrs ROP Grade

1 77/8" Smith MI616 JE2564 6/16 438' 6,360 5,922 72.0 82.2
Activity Summary (6:00am - 6:00am)

From To Hours| P/U |Summary

6:00 14:00 8.0 P |Drill 7 7/8" hole F/ 4930’ to 5498" w/ 20K WOB, TRPM-170,GPM-400,Avg ROP-71 ft/hr

14:00 14:30 0.5 P Rig Service, set crownomatic

14:30 16:30 2.0 P |Drill 7 7/8" hole F/ 5498' to 5687' w/ 20K WOB, TRPM-170,GPM-400,Avg ROP-95 ft/hr

16:30 17:30 1.0 U |Weld inside of drum, water spraying out,

17:30 1:30 8.0 P |Drill 7 7/8" hole F/ 5687' to 6355' w/20KWOB, TRPM-170,GPM-400,Avg ROP-84 ft/hr

1:30 2:30 1.0 P |Circulate bottoms up to lay down for logs

2:30 4:30 2.0 P Lay down drill pipe to 4000'

4:30 5:00 0.5 P Pump 260 bbls of 9.8 Ib brine water to kill flow

5:00 6:00 1.0 P Lay down drill pipe and BHA,
24 Hour Activity Summary:
Drill 7 7/8" hole F/ 4930' to 6355' w/20KWOB,TRPM-170,GPM-400,Avg ROP-79 ft/hr, rig service, set crownomatic, weld on inside of drum to fix leak,
Lay down drill pipe to 4000', pump 260 bbls 9.8lb brine, lay down drill pipe
24 Hour Plan Forward:
lay down drill pipe and BHA,log w/ halliburton, test rams,run casing, cement
Safety Weather Fuel
Last BOP Test: 1/14/2011 BOP Drill? yes High / Low 40/ 25 Diesel Used: 1,257
BOP Test Press: 2000 Function Test? Conditions: clear Diesel Recvd: 0
Newfield Pers. 9 Incidents? None Wind: preezy to 20 mpH Diesel on Loc: 5,553
Contract Pers. 1

RECEI VED: Jan. 06, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 59576 APl Well Nunber: 43013342290000

NEWFIELD Well Name: STATE 6-36-8-15
. Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 1/19/2011
ROCKY MOUNTAINS Present Ops: Wait on Completion
Field: GMBU CTB1 Rig Name: NDSI #3 Report No: Daily 5
Location: S36 T8S R15E KB: 12 Since Spud: 5
County: DUCHESNE Supervisor: Xabier Lasa 435-823-6014 AFE No: 19568
State: uT Supervisor 2: Daily Cost: 171,446
Elevation: 5761 Rig Phone: Cum. Cost: 382,205
Formation: GREEN RIVER Rig Email: Rig Release Date 01/19/11
Depth (MD): 6,355' PTD (MD): 6,320' Daily Footage: 0' Avg ROP:
Depth (TVD): 6,355 PTD (TVD): 6,320 Drilling Hours: 0.0 Exp TD Date: 1/17/2011
Casing Data:
Type Size Weight Grade Connection Top Bottom Shoe Test
Conductor 14 5'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 J-55 STC 481"
Production 51/2" 15.5 J-55 LTC 6,352'
Mud Properties: Drilling Parameters: BHA:
Type: Fresh water WOB: Component Length ID oD
Weight: 8.5 Tot RPM: Smith MI1616 PDC Bit 1.00'
Vis: 31 Torque: Hunting .33 Mud Motor 34.79'
PV: P/U Wt: XO 3.03'
YP: Rot Wit: Monel 30.82'
10s Gels: S/O Wt: Gap sub 3.34'
10m Gels: Max Pull: Index 1.84'
pH: Avg Gas: XO 2.98'
API Filtrate: Max Gas: 17 6" DC's 495.53'
HPHT Filtrate: Cnx Gas:
Cake: Trip Gas:
Qil/H,0 Ratio:
ES: Surveys:
MBT: Depth Inc Azi
Pm: 3,504' 2.54° 239.31°
Pf/Mf: / 3,946' 2.42° 230.67°
% Solids: 4,295' 2.46° 226.27° Total Length: 573.33
% LGS: 4,668' 2.29° 219.42°
% Sand: 5,017' 2.37° 210.19° Hydraulics:
LCM (ppb): 5,490’ 2.42° 197.01° PP: HHP/in*: AV DP/DC:
Calcium: 6,028 2.50° 209.93° GPM: %P @ bit: SPR #1: 90-630
Chlorides: 6,355' 1.89° 209.09° TFA: Jet Vel: SPR #2:
Bit Info:
Bit # Size Make Type SIN Jets In Out Footage Hrs ROP Grade
1 77/8" Smith MI616 JE2564 6/16 438' 6,360’ 5,922' 72.0 82.2 1-1-TD

Activity Summary (6:00am - 6:00am)

From To Hours| P/U |Summary

6:00 8:00 2.0 P Lay down drill pipe and BHA , directional tools

8:00 19:00 11.0 P Rig up Halliburton,Log f/6355' to surface,density,porosity,sonic wave,

19:00 19:30 0.5 P |Change rams test w/ B&C Quicktest to 2000#/10 minutes, tested good

19:30 23:00 3.5 P R/U QT Casing and run 151jts of 5.5",15.5#,J-55 set @ 6351.78', land w/ mandrill

23:00 1:00 2.0 P |Circulate

1:00 3:30 2.5 P |Cement w/300 sks of lead (PL 11+3%KCL+.05#SF+.5#CF+2%kol seal)@ 11ppg and 3.53 yield and 400 sks of
tail (50:50:2+3%KCL+.05#SF+.25#CF+.5%EC-1) mixed @ 14.4ppg and 1.24 yield, displaced w/ 150.5 bbls
of fresh, returned 20 bbls to pit,bump plug to 2276psi, BLM and State were notified via email of TD

3:30 6:00 2.5 P |Clean mud tanks

24 Hour Activity Summary:
Lay down drill pipe and Bha,R/U Halliburton and log, loggers TD-6355', change rams and test to 2000#/10 min. R/U QT Casing and run 151 jts 5.5"
set @ 6351.78', Cement w/ 300sks lead 400sks tail, returned 20 bbls to pit, clean mud tanks

24 Hour Plan Forward:
rig down and move rig

Safety Weather Fuel

Last BOP Test: 1/14/2011 BOP Drill? yes High / Low 35/10 Diesel Used: 999
BOP Test Press: 2000 Function Test? Yes Conditions: clear Diesel Recvd: 0
Newfield Pers. 9 Incidents? None Wind: breezy Diesel on Loc: 4,554
Contract Pers. 18

RECEI VED: Jan. 06, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 59576 APl Well Nunber: 43013342290000

NEWFIELD Well Name: STATE 6-36-8-15
Final Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 1/20/2011
ROCKY MOUNTAINS Present Ops: Wait on Completion
Field: GMBU CTB1 Rig Name: NDSI #3 Report No: Daily 6
Location: S36 T8S R15E KB: 12 Since Spud: 6
County: DUCHESNE Supervisor: Xabier Lasa 435-823-6014 AFE No: 19568
State: uT Supervisor 2: Daily Cost: 6,675
Elevation: 5761 Rig Phone: Cum. Cost: 388,880
Formation: GREEN RIVER Rig Email: Rig Release Date 01/19/11
Depth (MD): 6,355' PTD (MD): 6,320' Daily Footage: 0' Avg ROP:
Depth (TVD): 6,355 PTD (TVD): 6,320 Drilling Hours: Exp TD Date: 1/17/2011
Casing Data:
Type Size Weight Grade Connection Top Bottom Shoe Test
Conductor 14 5'
Surface 8 5/8" 24 J-55 STC 481"
Production 51/2" 15.5 J-55 LTC 6,352'
Mud Properties: Drilling Parameters: BHA:
Type: Fresh water WOB: Component Length ID oD
Weight: 8.5 Tot RPM: Smith MI1616 PDC Bit 1.00'
Vis: 31 Torque: Hunting .33 Mud Motor 34.79'
PV: P/U Wt: XO 3.03'
YP: Rot Wit: Monel 30.82
10s Gels: S/O Wt: Gap sub 3.34'
10m Gels: Max Pull: Index 1.84'
pH: Avg Gas: XO 2.98'
API Filtrate: Max Gas: 17 6" DC's 495.53'
HPHT Filtrate: Cnx Gas:
Cake: Trip Gas:
Qil/H,0 Ratio:
ES: Surveys:
MBT: Depth Inc Azi
Pm: 3,504' 2.54° 239.31°
Pf/Mf: / 3,946' 2.42° 230.67°
% Solids: 4,295' 2.46° 226.27° Total Length: 573.33
% LGS: 4,668' 2.29° 219.42°
% Sand: 5,017' 2.37° 210.19° Hydraulics:
LCM (ppb): 5,490’ 2.42° 197.01° PP: HHP/in*: AV DP/DC:
Calcium: 6,028 2.50° 209.93° GPM: %P @ bit: SPR #1: 90-630
Chlorides: 6,355' 1.89° 209.09° TFA: Jet Vel: SPR #2:
Bit Info:
Bit # Size Make Type SIN Jets In Out Footage Hrs ROP Grade
1 77/8" Smith MI616 JE2564 6/16 438' 6,360’ 5,922' 72.0 82.2 1-1-TD

Activity Summary (6:00am - 6:00am)

From To Hours| P/U |Summary

6:00 7:30 1.5 P Rig down and prepare for rig move
Release Rig @ 07:30

24 Hour Activity Summary:
rig down prepare for rig move

24 Hour Plan Forward:
move rig to State 12-36-8-15 on 1-19-11.

Safety Weather Fuel

Last BOP Test: 1/14/2011 BOP Drill? no High / Low 30/15 Diesel Used: 254
BOP Test Press: 2000 Function Test? No Conditions: clear Diesel Recvd: 0
Newfield Pers. 9 Incidents? None Wind: breezy Diesel on Loc: 4,300
Contract Pers. 0

RECEI VED: Jan. 06, 2015



Sundry Nunber :

59576 API

Vel | Nunber:

43013342290000
NEWFIELD PRODUCTION COMPANY - CASING & CEMENT REPORT

8 5/8" CASING SET AT 480.57
LAST CASING 14 SETAT 5 OPERATOR Newfield Exploration Company
DATUM 12 WELL STATE 6-36-8-15
DATUM TO CUT OFF CASING 12 FIELD/PROSPECT Monument Butte
DATUM TO BRADENHEAD FLANGE 12 CONTRACTOR & RIG # Ross #29
TD DRILLER 480 LOGGER
HOLE SIZE 12 1/4"
LOG OF CASING STRING:
PIECES oD ITEM - MAKE - DESCRIPTION WT/FT | GRD | THREAD| CONDT LENGTH

1 Wellhead A 1.42

11 8 5/8" |Casing (shoe jt 43.05) 24 J-55 STC A 468.25

1 8 5/8" |Guide Shoe 0.9
CASING INVENTORY BAL. FEET JTS TOTAL LENGTH OF STRING 470.57
TOTAL LENGTH OF STRING 470.57 11 LESS CUT OFF PIECE 2
LESS NON CSG. ITEMS 2.32 PLUS DATUM TO T/CUT OFF CSG 12
PLUS FULL JTS. LEFT OUT 0 CASING SET DEPTH 480.57

TOTAL 468.25 11
TOTAL CSG. DEL. (W/O THRDS) } COMPARE
TIMING

BEGIN RUN CSG. Spud| 4:00PM | 12/23/2010 [GOOD CIRC THRU JOB Yes
CSG. IN HOLE 6:00 PM | 12/23/2010 |Bbls CMT CIRC TO SURFACE 5
BEGIN CIRC 1:12 PM 1/10/2011  |RECIPROCATED PIP __No
BEGIN PUMP CMT 1:23 PM 1/10/2011
BEGIN DSPL. CMT 1:39 PM 1/10/2011  |BUMPED PLUG TO 183
PLUG DOWN 1:48 PM 1/10/2011

RECEI VED: Jan.

06, 2015



Sundry Nunber :

59576 APl Well Nunber: 43013342290000

CEMENT USED CEMENT COMPANY- BJ
STAGE # SX CEMENT TYPE & ADDITIVES
1 220 Class "G"+2%CaCl Mixed @ 15.8ppg W/1.17yield Returned 5bbls to pit

CENTRALIZER & SCRATCHER PLACEMENT |

SHOW MAKE & SPACING

Middle of first, top of second and third for a total of three.

COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE Adam Ferrari

DATE 1/10/2011

RECEI VED: Jan.

06, 2015



Sundry Nunber :

59576 API

Vel |

Nunber :

43013342290000

NEWFIELD PRODUCTION COMPANY - CASING & CEMENT REPORT

51/2" CASING SET AT 6351.78
LAST CASING 85/8" SETAT 481 OPERATOR Newfield Exploration Company
DATUM 12 WELL STATE 6-36-8-15
DATUM TO CUT OFF CASING 12 FIELD/PROSPECT Monument Butte
DATUM TO BRADENHEAD FLANGE 12 CONTRACTOR & RIG # NDSI # 3
TD DRILLER 6355 LOGC 6355
HOLE SIZE 7"
LOG OF CASING STRING:
PIECES oD ITEM - MAKE - DESCRIPTION WT/FT | GRD | THREAD| CONDT LENGTH
1 51/2" |Landing jt. 15.5 J-55 LTC A 16
150 51/2" |LT&C Casing 15.5 J-55 LTC a 6303.78

1 51/2" [Float collar A 1.5

1 51/2" |LT&C Casing 15.5 J-55 LTC A 33

1 51/2" |Guide shoe A 1.5
CASING INVENTORY BAL. FEET JTS TOTAL LENGTH OF STRING 6355.78
TOTAL LENGTH OF STRING 6355.78 LESS CUT OFF PIECE 16
LESS NON CSG. ITEMS 19 PLUS DATUM TO T/CUT OFF CSG 12
PLUS FULL JTS. LEFT OUT 42.73 1 CASING SET DEPTH 6,351.78

TOTAL 6379.51 1
TOTAL CSG. DEL. (W/O THRDS) 6379.51 152 } COMPARE
TIMING

BEGIN RUN CSG. Spud| 7:30 PM 1/18/2011 |GOOD CIRC THRU JOB Yes
CSG. IN HOLE 11:00 PM| 1/18/2011 |Bbls CMT CIRC TO SURFACE 20
BEGIN CIRC 11:00 PM| 1/18/2011 |RECIPROCATED PIP __No
BEGIN PUMP CMT 1:30 AM 1/19/2011
BEGIN DSPL. CMT 2:30 AM 1/19/2011 |BUMPED PLUG TO 2276
PLUG DOWN 2:52 AM 1/19/2011

RECEI VED: Jan.

06, 2015



Sundry Nunber :

59576 APl Well Nunber: 43013342290000

CEMENT USED CEMENT COMPANY- Bj Services
STAGE # SX CEMENT TYPE & ADDITIVES

1 300 PL [1+3%KCL+.05#SF+.5#CF+2%kol seal

2 400  |50:50:2+3%KCL+.05#SF+.25#CF+5%EC-1

CENTRALIZER & SCRATCHER PLACEMENT |

SHOW MAKE & SPACING

Middlde of first, top of second and third then every third for a total of 20.

COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE Xabier Lasa

DATE 1/19/2011

RECEI VED: Jan.

06, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 62448 APl Well Nunber: 43013342290000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-21835 '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below

current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7éli/';‘l'3L°rG(:RARAGREEMENT NAME:
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. ( V)

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
STATE 6-36-8-15

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
NEWFIELD PRODUCTION COMPANY 43013342290000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
Rt 3 Box 3630 , Myton, UT, 84052 435 646-4825 Ext MONUMENT BUTTE
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
2099 FNL 2053 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: SENW Section: 36 Township: 08.0S Range: 15.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
] NOTICE OF INTENT [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
1/ SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION
D OPERATOR CHANGE v" PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D D |:|
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER: I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
The State 6-36-8-15 was Plugged and Abandoned on 03/12/2015. See Accepted by the
Attached Procedure. Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
April 15, 2015

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Mandie Crozier 435 646-4825 Regulatory Tech
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 4/8/2015

RECEI VED: Apr. 08, 2015




Sundry Nunber :

62448 API

Vel | Nunber:

43013342290000

NEWFIELD

Well Name: State 6-36-8-15

Summary Rig Activity

Job Category Job Start Date Jeb End Date
Daily Operations
Report Start Date Report End Date 24hr Activity Summary
3/12/2015 3/12/2015 MIRUSU. TIH tbg. Cement well. LD tbg. RDMOSU.
Start Time End Time Comment
07:00 08:30 Well was shut in.
Start Time €nd Ttime Comment
08:30 12:30 GPS 40.0759589°N, 110.1825844°W. 07:00-07:30 Crew Travel. 07:30-08:00 JSA and Safety Meeting with rig
crew. 08:00-08:30 Rig up rig, set in pipe trailers.
Start Time End Ttime Comment
12:30 16:30 08:30-09:30 Nipple down Night cap & nipple up stripping head then rig up flowback and fiat tank. 09:30-12:30
Tally and PU 2 7/8" tbg, RIH to 3886, instal | washington head rubber.
Start Time End Time Comment
16:30 18:00 12:30-13:00 Richard Powell w/ State of Utah witnessed all cementing. Pump 3.6 bbls(20.6 ft*3) of type G
cement then flush TBG with 20.5 bbls fresh water, (Cement in Place at 12:48) POOH 4 stands to 3638' then
reverse circ. 35 bbls (Returned 3 bbl of interface water). 13:00-16:30 Wait on Cement,
Start Time End Time Comment
18:00 19:00 16:30-17:00 RIH to 3766' tag Cement top Pull out to 3766 and Pump 70 bbls of H20 treated with Biocide and
Corrosion inhibitor to displace water up to 500'17:00-18:00 Pull out of hole, Stand back 8 stands then Lay down
TBG.
Start Time End Time Comment
19:00 20:00 18:00-19:00 Trip in 8 stds to 497" Pump 13 bbls (73 ft*3)Type G cement, POOH, Lay down Tbg and nipple down
B-section. Fill up "top out” with 1.4 bbls (7.8 ft*3) type G cement (all cement in place at 18:35) Wash up and rig
down Pro Petro.
Start Time End Time Comment
20:00 21:00 RDMOSU.
[Start Tme End Time Comment
21:00 00:00 SIFN.
Report Start Date Report End Date 24hr Activity Summary
3/16/2015 3/16/2015 Dig up well head. Top cement off. Instal dry hole marker.
Start Time End Time Comment
13:15 156:30 Richard Powell w/ State Of Utah witness cementing. Dig up wellhead. Cut off welthead. RU Pro Petro. Pump 50
sxs cement down surface casing. Had 4 bbls cement returned to pit. Insta platte & 10' x 4" marker pole. Backfill
surface. Removed deadmen anchors.

www.newfield.com

Page 1/1

Report Printed: 4/8/2015




APl VeIl Nunber: 43013342290000
(March 2012
UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG

FORM APPROVED
OMB NO. 1004-0137
Expires: October 31, 2014

5 Lease Serial No

ML-21835
la_ Type of Well WMoiwell  [JGaswell [IDnv [ Other 6 If Indian. Allottee or Tribe Name
b Tvpe of Completion O Newwell T work Over [ Deepen (| Plug Back [J Duff Resvr.
Other P&A 7 Unmitor CA Agreement Name and No

UTU87538X

Name of Operator

8 Lease Name and Well No
State 6-36-8-15

5
NEWFIELD EXPLORATION

Address ROUTE #3 BOX 3630 3a Phone No. finclude area code)
MYTON, UT 84052 Ph:435-646-3721

9. API Well No.
43-013-34229

4. Locauon of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements)*

Atsurface 2099 FNL 2053 FWL SE/NW Section 36, T8S R15E

Attop prod interval reported below

At total depth

10. Field and Pool or Exploratory
MONUMENT BUTTE

11 Sec.T.R.,M. onBlock and
Survev or Area SEC 36. T8S R15E

12 County or Parish 13 State

DUCHESNE uT

14 Date Spudded 15 Date T.D Reached 16 Date Completed 01/20/2011

17 FElevations (DF, RKB. RT. GL}*

12/23/2010 01/18/2011 [Op&a [7] Ready to Prod 5761' GL 5773'KB
18 Total Depth MD 6355 19 PlugBack TD.. MD 6320 20. Depth Bridge Plug Set: MDD
TVD 6355 TVD 6320 TVD
2] Type Flectric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy of each) 22 Was well cored? bINo [ Yes (Submit analysis)
Was DST run? I No [ Yes (Submut report)
CMT BOND Directional Survey? [Z1No  [] Yes (Submit copy)
23, Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)
Hole Size | Size/Grade | Wt (#/ft) |  Top (MD) Bottom (MD) S‘agi)gzme“‘“ TI:‘; fo zt;f;n S't'gg;’)"l' Cement Top* Amount Pulled
12-1/4" 8-5/8" J-55 |24 0 481 220 CLASS G
7-7/8" 5-1/2" J-55 | 15.50 0 6352 Lead 300 Prem Light
Tail 400 50/50 POZ
24 Tubing Record
Swze Depth Set (MDD Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) | Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MDD
25 Producing Intervals 26 Perforation Record
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No_Holes Perf Status
A)
B)
)
D)
27 Aad, Fracture. Treatment. Cement Squeeze, etc
Depth Interval Amount and Type of Material
28 Production - Interval A
Date First  [Test Date  [Hours [Test 011 Gas Water O1l Gravity Gas [Production Method
Produced Tested IProduction |BBIL. MCF BBL Corr API Gravity
Choke Tbg Press Csg 24 Hr 01l Gas ‘Water IGas/Onl Well Status
Size Flwg Press Rate BBL MCF BBL [Ratio
SI .
28a Production - Interval B
Date First  [Test Date  [Hours Test 011 IGas Water 101l Gravity 1as Production Method
Produced Tested Production |BBL IMCF BBL iCorr AP1 Gravity
Choke ITbg Press [Csg 24 Hr 1011 IGas Water IGas/O1l Well Status
Size Flwg Press Rate BBL IMCF IBBL. Ratio
ISI '

*(See nstructions and spaces for additional data on page 2)

RECEI VED: Apr. 13, 2015



APl Vel Nunber: 43013342290000

28b. Production - Interval C

Date First [Test Date [Hours [Test 10l IGas [Water |01l Gravity iGas [Production Method
Produced Tested IProduction [BBL MCF BBL ICorr. API iGravity
Choke [Tbg. Press. [Csg. 124 Hr. 10il IGas [Water IGas/Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. [Press. IRate IBBL MCF BBL IRatio
ST

v

28c. Production - Interval D

Date First [Test Date [Hours [Test 0il Gas Water |0il Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced [Tested [Production |[BBL IMCF BBL ICorr. API Gravity
Choke [Tbg. Press.|Csg. 24 Hr. 01l IGas Water iGas/Oil (Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. IRate BBL IMCF IBBL [Ratio
ISI

v

29. Disposition of Gas (Solid, used for fuel, vented, etc.)

30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

) GEOLOGICAL MARKERS
Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests,
including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures and

recoveries.
Top
Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name
Meas. Depth
GREEN RIVER FORMATION 1605
GARDEN GULCH MEMBER 4135
32. Additional remarks (include plugging procedure):
This well was SPUD in 2011. The well was drilled but never completed.
Well was Plugged and Abandoned on 3/12/15. See P&A Sundry for Details.
33. Indicate which items have been attached by placing a check in the appropriate boxes:
[[] Electrical/Mechanical Logs (1 full set req’d.) [ Geologic Report 1 DST Report [ Directional Survey
[] Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification [ Core Analysis [Z] Other: Daily Drilling Reports and Casing and Cement Reports

34. T hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

Name (please prinyy Mandig Crozier A Title Regulatory Specialist
A # -
Signature M %&1/‘) Date 04/13/2015
L7

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any
false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Continued on page 3) (Form 3160-4, page 2)

RECEI VED: Apr. 13, 2015



NEWFIELD Well Name: STATE 6-36-8-15

ke | Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 1/13/2011
ROCKY MOUNTAINS Present Ops: Waiting on Cement
Field: GMBU CTB1 Rig Name: Ross #29 Report No: SPUD 1
Location: S36 T8S R15E KB: 12 Since Spud:
County: DUCHESNE Supervisor: Adam Ferrari AFE No: 19568
State: uT Supervisor 2: Daily Cost: 71,156
Elevation: 5761 Rig Phone: 435- 823-6740 Cum. Cost: 71,156
Formation: UINTAH Rig Email: aferrari@newfield.com Rig Release Date 01/19/11
Depth (MD): 480’ PTD (MD): 480" Daily Footage: Avg ROP:
Depth (TVD): 480 PTD (TVD): 480" Drilling Hours: Exp TD Date:
Casing Data:
Type Size Weight Grade Connection Top Bottom Shoe Test
Conductor 14 0' 5'
ac o 85!18:”\1 1'1Af\'2ﬁ\nnnr J-55 STC 0 481"
M—NWI T HoULIPoAZzZ2 000
Mud Properties: Drilling Parameters: BHA:
Type: Air/Mist WOB: Component Length 1D 0D
Weight: Tot RPM:
Vis: Torque:
PV: P/U Wt:
YP: Rot Wt:
10s Gels: S/0 Wt:
10m Gels: Max Pull:
pH: Avg Gas:
API Filtrate: Max Gas:
HPHT Filtrate: Cnx Gas:
Cake: Trip Gas:
Qil/H,0 Ratio:
ES: Surveys:
MBT: Depth Inc Azi
Pm:
PfIMf: /
% Solids: Total Length: 0.00
% LGS:
% Sand: Hydraulics:
LCM (ppb): PP: HHP/in*: AV DP/DC:
Calcium: GPM: %P @ bit: SPR#1:
Chiorides: TFA: Jet Vel: SPR #2:
Bit Info:
Bit # Size Make Type SIN Jets In Out Footage Hrs ROP Grade

Activity Summary (6:00am - 6:00am)

From To Hours| P /U |Summary
On 12-23-10 Ross # 29 spud and drilled 480 of 12 1/4" hole, P/U and run 11 jts. Of 8 5/8" casing set
@ 468.25'. On 1-10-11 cement w/ BJ w/ 220 sks of class G+2%kcl+.25#CF mixed @ 15.8ppg and 1.17
yield. Returned 5bbls to pit, bump plug to 183 psi, BLM and State were notified of spud via email.

24 Hour Activity Summary:
On 12-23-10 Ross #29 spud and drilled 480 of 12 1/4" hole, P/U and run 11 jts of 8 5/8" casing set @ 468.25', On 1-10-11 cement w/ BJ w/ 220 sks of
class G+2%kcl+.25#CF mixed @ 15.8ppg and 1.17 yield. Returned 5bbls to pit

24 Hour Plan Forward:
Wait on NDSI #3

Safety Weather Fuel

Last BOP Test: BOP Drill? High / Low 0/-20 Diesel Used:

BOP Test Press: Function Test? Conditions: clear Diesel Recvd: 0
Newfield Pers. 1 Incident None Wind: calm Diesel on Loc: 0
Contract Pers. 6

RECEI VED: Apr. 13, 2015



NEWFIELD Well Name: STATE 6-36-8-15
:m Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 1/14/2011
ROCKY MOUNTAINS Present Ops: Rigging down
Field: GMBU CTB1 Rig Name: NDSI #3 Report No: MOB 1
Location: $36 T8S R15E KB: 12 Since Spud: 0
County: DUCHESNE Supervisor: Johnny Davis 435-823-3612 AFE No: 19568
State: uT Supervisor 2: Daily Cost: 4,060
Elevation: 5761 Rig Phone: Cum. Cost: 75,216
Formation: UINTAH Rig Email: Rig Release Date 01/19/11
Depth (MD): 480 PTD (MD): 6,320' Daily Footage: 0' Avg ROP:
Depth (TVD): 480" PTD (TVD): 6,320’ Drilling Hours: 0.0 Exp TD Date:
Casing Data:
Type Size Weight Grade Connection Top Bottom Shoe Test
Conductor 14 5'
PEviel | Nupber-43043342290066—— e il
Mud Properties: Drilling Parameters: BHA:
Type: WOB: Component Length 1D oD
Weight: Tot RPM:
Vis: Torque:
PV: P/U Wt:
YP: Rot Wt:
10s Gels: S/O Wt:
10m Gels: Max Puli:
pH: Avg Gas:
API Filtrate: [Max Gas:
HPHT Filtrate: Cnx Gas:
Cake: Trip Gas:
Oil/H,0 Ratio:
ES: Surveys:
MBT: Depth Inc Azi
Pm:
PfIMf: /
% Solids: Total Length: 0.00
% LGS:
% Sand: Hydraulics:
LCM (ppb): PP: HHP/in*; AV DP/DC:
Calcium: GPM: %P @ bit: SPR #1:
Chlorides: TFA: Jet Vel: SPR #2:
Bit Info:
Bit # Size Make Type SIN Jets In Out Footage Hrs ROP Grade
Activity Summary (6:00am - 6:00am)
From To Hours | P /U |Summary
23:00 6:00 7.0 P |RD to move rig # 3 from Federal 13-25-8-15 to State 6-36-8-15
24 Hour Activity Summary:
RD to move rig # 3 from Federal 13-25-8-15 to State 6-36-8-15
24 Hour Plan Forward:
Move rig to State 6-36-8-15 /RU /Pressure test/PU BHA /Drill
Safety Weather Fuel
Last BOP Test: BOP Drili? no High / Low 17/-5 Diesel Used: 0
BOP Test Press: Function Test? No Conditions: Clear Diesel Recvd: 0
Newfield Pers. 6 Incidents? None Wind: Calm Diesel on Loc: 2,450
Contract Pers. 0
RECEI VED: Apr. 13, 2015




NEWFIELD

F E_—a b/
== e )

ROCKY MOUNTAINS

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name:

Report Date:
Present Ops:

STATE 6-36-8-15

1/15/2011

Drill 7 7/8" hole with fresh water

Field: GMBU CTBH1 Rig Name: NDSI #3 Report No: Daily 1
Location: S36 T8S R15E KB: 12 Since Spud: 1
County: DUCHESNE Supervisor: Johnny Davis 435-823-3612 AFE No: 19568
State: uT Supervisor 2: Daily Cost: 65,547
Elevation: 5761 Rig Phone: Cum. Cost: 140,763
Formation: UINTAH Rig Email: Rig Release Date 01/19/11
Depth (MD): 1,190’ PTD (MD): 6,320' Daily Footage: 710' Avg ROP: 101.4
Depth (TVD): 1,190' PTD (TVD): 6,320’ Drilling Hours: 7.0 Exp TD Date: 1/17/2011
Casing Data:
Type Size Weight Grade Connection Top Bottom Shoe Test
Conductor 14 5
AP e - Narer-2243013342380000 ST wls
Mud Properties: Drilling Parameters: BHA:
Type: Fresh water WOB: 18 Component Length ID oD
Weight: 8.5 Tot RPM: 65 Smith MI616 PDC Bit 1.00'
Vis: 31 Torque: Hunting .33 Mud Motor 34.79
PV: P/U Wt: X0 3.03'
Y.BE Rot Wt: Monel 30.82'
10s Gels: S/O Wt: Gap sub 3.34
10m Gels: Max Puli: Index 1.84'
pH: Avg Gas: XO 2.98'
API Filtrate: Max Gas: 17 6" DC's 495.53'
HPHT Filtrate: Cnx Gas:
Cake: Trip Gas:
Oil/H,0 Ratio:
ES: Surveys:
MBT: Depth Inc Azi
Pm: 512 0.53° 6.77°
PfIMf: / 795' 0.44° 26.01°
% Solids: 955' 0.79° 36.56° Total Length: 673588
% LGS:
% Sand: Hydraulics:
LCM (ppb): EE 800 HHP/in*; AV DP/DC: | MD 80 pump
Calcium: GPM: 420 %P @ bit: SPR #1:
Chlorides: TFA: Jet Vel: SPR #2:
Bit Info:
Bit # Size Make Type SIN Jets In Out Footage | Hrs | ROP Grade

1 778" Smith MI616 6/16 438' 752 7.0 107.4
Activity Summary (6:00am - 6:00am)

From To Hours| P/U |Summary

6:00 14:00 8.0 P |On 1/14/11 Jones Trucking moved Rig # 3 from Federal 13-25-8-15 to State 6-36-8-15/Set all Equipment

14:00 17:30 3.5 P |RU Quick test/Test Kelly,Safety Valve,Pipe & Blind rams & Choke to 2000 psi for10 min./All OK/

Test Casing to 1500 psi for 30 min./OK

17:30 20:00 2.5 P |PU BHA with Pay Zone Directional tools/ Tag Cmt. @ 438'

20:00 21:30 1.5 P Drill 7 7/8" hole from 438’ to 530/WOB 12/RPM 65/GPM 420/ROP 61 FPH

21:30 22:30 1.0 U |Work on Pason pressure sensor

22:30 23:30 1.0 P Drill 7 7/8" hole from 530" to 614' /WOB 18/RPM 65/GPM 420/ROP 84 FPH

23:30 0:00 0.5 P |Install rotating head rubber and Drive bushings.

0:00 1:00 1.0 P Drill 7 7/8" hole from 614’ to 708'/WOB 18/RPM 65/ GPM 420/ROP 94 FPH

1:00 2:00 1.0 U |Thaw lines to Yellow dog pump

2:00 6:00 4.0 P Drill 7 7/8" hole from 708" to 1190 /WOB 18/RPM 65/GPM 420/ROP121 FPH
24 Hour Activity Summary:
On 1/14/11 Jones Trucking moved rig from Fed. 13-25-8-15 to State 6-36-8-15/Set equip./Quick test tested BOP’s to 2000 psi for 10 min. & Csg. To
1500 psi for 30 min./All tested good/Changed 1 door gasket./PU BHA /tag @ 438'/Drill 7 7/8" to 1190'/WOB 18/
24 Hour Plan Forward:
Drill
Safety Weather Fuel
Last BOP Test: 1/14/2011 BOP Drili? yes High / Low 17 /1 Diesel Used: 1,000
BOP Test Press: 2000 Function Test? Yes Conditions: Clear Diesel Recvd: 7,000
Newfield Pers. 11 Incidents? None Wind: calm Diesel on Loc: 8,930
Contract Pers. ' 17

RECEI VED: Apr. 13, 2015



NEWFIELD

GURKY MOUNTAINS

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name:
Report Date:

Present Ops:

STATE 6-36-8-15
1/16/2011
Drill 7 7/8" hole with fresh water

Field: GMBU CTB1 Rig Name: NDSI #3 Report No: Daily 2
Location: S36 T8S R15E KB: 12 Since Spud: 2
County: DUCHESNE Supervisor: Johnny Davis 435-823-3612 AFE No: 19568
State: uT Supervisor 2: Daily Cost: 36,526
Elevation: 5761 Rig Phone: Cum. Cost: 177,289
Formation: GREEN RIVER Rig Email: Rig Release Date 01/19/11
Depth (MD): 3,229 PTD (MD): 6,320 Daily Footage: 2,039 Avg ROP: 86.8
Depth (TVD): 3,229 PTD (TVD): 6,320 Drilling Hours: 23.5 Exp TD Date: 1/17/2011
Casing Data:
Type Size Weight Grade Connection Top Bottom Shoe Test
Conductor 14 5'
APL Vel | Number: 43013342200000—— - wll
Mud Properties: Drilling Parameters: BHA:
Type: Fresh water WOB: 18 Component Length ID oD
Weight: 8.5 Tot RPM: 67 Smith MI616 PDC Bit 1.00'
Vis: 31 Torque: Hunting .33 Mud Motor 34.79'
PV: P/U Wt: 109,000 X0 3.03'
YP: Rot Wt: Monel 30.82"
10s Gels: S/O Wt: Gap sub 3.34'
10m Gels: Max Pull: Index 1.84'
pH: Avg Gas: XO 2.98'
API Filtrate: Max Gas: 17 6" DC's 495.53'
HPHT Filtrate: Cnx Gas:
Cake: Trip Gas:
Oil/H,0 Ratio:
ES: Surveys:
MBT: Depth Inc Azi
Pm: 512 0.53° 6.77°
PfIMf: / 795' 0.44° 26.01°
% Solids: 955" 0.79° 36.56° Total Length: 573.33
% LGS: 1,613 0.66° 21.71°
% Sand: 2,434 0.88° 244.07° Hydraulics:
LCM (ppb): 2,684’ 1.41° 217.92° PP: 1220 HHP/in": AV DP/DC: | MD80 pump
Calcium: 3,061 2.24° 232.51° GPM: 420 %P @ bit: SPR#1: V0 psi@ 92 sp
Chlorides: TFA: Jet Vel: SPR #2:
Bit Info:
Bit # Size Make Type SIN Jets In Out Footage | Hrs ROP Grade

1 77/8" Smith MI616 6/16 438' 2,7917_ 30.5 91.5
Activity Summary (6:00am - 6:00am)

From To Hours| P /U |Summary

6:00 16:30 10.5 P Drill 7 7/8" hole from 1240' to 2189/WOB 18/RPM 67/GPM 420/ROP 90 FPH

16:30 17:00 0.5 P |Rig service/Function test BOP's & Crown-O-Matic/OK

17:00 6:00 13.0 P Drill 7 7/8" hole from 2189’ to 3229'/WOB 18/RPM 67/GPM 420/ROP 80FPH

No Slides

24 Hour Activity Summary:

Drill 7 7/8" hole from 1240' to 3229'/WOB 18/RPM 67/GPM 420/ROP 85 FPH/H2S 0 PPM/Flow 0 GPM/Last survey @ 3061’ 2.24° Dir. 232.51

24 Hour Plan Forward:

Drill

Safety Weather Fuel
Last BOP Test: 1/14/2011 BOP Drill? yes High / Low 11/-5 Diesel Used: 649
BOP Test Press: 2000 Function Test? Yes Conditions: Cloudy Diesel Recvd: 0
Newfield Pers. 9 Incidents? None Wind: Calm Diesel on Loc: 8,281
Contract Pers. 4

RECEI VED: Apr. 13, 2015



NEWFIELD Well Name: STATE 6-36-8-15
Ll | Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 1/17/2011

ROCKY MOUNTAINS Present Ops: Drill 7 7/8" hole with fresh water

Field: GMBU CTB1 Rig Name: NDSI #3 Report No: Daily 3
Location: $36 T8S R15E KB: 12 Since Spud: 3
County: DUCHESNE Supervisor: Xabier Lasa 435-823-6014 AFE No: 19568
State: Ut Supervisor 2: Daily Cost: 15,785
Elevation: 5761 Rig Phone: Cum. Cost: 193,074
Formation: GREEN RIVER Rig Email: Rig Release Date 01/19/11
Depth (MD): 6,320' PTD (MD): 6,320' Daily Footage: 3,091 Avg ROP: 131.5
Depth (TVD): 6,320’ PTD (TVD): 6,320' Drilling Hours: 23.5 Exp TD Date: 1/17/2011
Casing Data:
Type Size Weight Grade Connection Top Bottom Shoe Test
Conductor 14 5'
APECNS I Nurer— 4301834220000 Eneel 25
Mud Properties: Drilling Parameters: BHA:
Type: Fresh water WOB: 20,000 Component Length 1D oD
Weight: 8.5 Tot RPM: 175 Smith MI616 PDC Bit 1.00'
Vis: 31 Torque: Hunting .33 Mud Motor 34.79
PV: P/U Wt: X0 3.03'
YP: Rot Wt: Monel 30.82
10s Gels: S/O Wt: Gap sub 3.34'
10m Gels: Max Pull: Index 1.84'
pH: Avg Gas: XO 2.98'
API Filtrate: Max Gas: 17 6" DC's 495.53'
HPHT Filtrate: Cnx Gas:
Cake: Trip Gas:
Oil/H,0 Ratio:
ES: Surveys:
MBT: Depth inc Azi
Pm: 1.613" 0.66° 21.71°
PfIMf: / 2,434 0.88° 244.07°
% Solids: 2,684 1.41° 217.92° Total Length: 573.33
% LGS: 3,061 2.24° 232.51°
% Sand: 3,504 2.54° 239.31° Hydraulics:
LCM (ppb): 3,946 2.42° 230.67° PP: 1350  |HHPfin®: AV DP/DC:
Calcium: 4,295 2.46° 226.27° GPM: 405 %P @ bit: SPR #1: 90-630
Chlorides: 4,668' 2.29° 219.42° TFA: Jet Vel: SPR #2:
Bit Info:
Bit # Size Make Type SIN Jets In Out Footage Hrs ROP Grade

1 7 7/8" Smith MI616 JE2564 6/16 438’ 4,492' 54.0 83.2
Activity Summary (6:00am - 6:00am)

From To Hours| P /U |Summary

6:00 14:00 8.0 P Drill 7 7/8" hole F/ 3229' to 3828' w/ 20K WOB, TRPM-175,GPM-410,Avg ROP-75 ft/hr

14:00 14:30 0.5 P |Rig Service, check crownomatic and BOP , check flow=no flow

14:30 6:00 15.5 P Drill 7 7/8" hole F/ 3828' to 4930' w/ 20K WOB, TRPM-175,GPM-405,Avg ROP-71 ft/hr

No H2S or flow in last 24 hours

24 Hour Activity Summary:
Drill 7 7/8" hole F/ 3229 to 3828' w/ 20K WOB, TRPM-175,GPM-410,Avg ROP-75 ft/hr, Rig Service, check crownomatic and BOP , check flow=no
flow, Drill 7 7/8" hole F/ 3828' to 4930' w/ 20K WOB, TRPM-175,GPM-405,Avg ROP-71 ft/hr,No H2S or flow in last 24 hours

24 Hour Plan Forward:
Drill ahead toward TD.

Safety Weather Fuel
Last BOP Test: 1/14/2011 BOP Drill? yes High / Low 15/-5 Diesel Used: 1,471
BOP Test Press: 2000 Function Test? Yes Conditions: clear Diesel Recvd: 0
Newfield Pers. 9 Incidents? None Wind: calm Diesel on Loc: 6,810
Contract Pers. 2

RECEI VED: Apr. 13, 2015




NEWFIELD Well Name: STATE 6-36-8-15
T Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 1/18/2011
ROCKY MOUNTAINS Present Ops: Lay Down Drill Pipe/BHA
Field: GMBU CTB1 Rig Name: NDSI #3 Report No: Daily 4
Location: $36 T8S R15E KB: 12 Since Spud: 4
County: DUCHESNE Supervisor: Xabier Lasa 435-823-6014 AFE No: 19568
State: uT Supervisor 2: Daily Cost: 17,685
Elevation: 5761 Rig Phone: Cum. Cost: 210,759
Formation: GREEN RIVER Rig Email: Rig Release Date 01/19/11
Depth (MD): 6,355' PTD (MD): 6,320' Daily Footage: 35' Avg ROP: 1.9
Depth (TVD): 6,355' PTD (TVD): 6,320' Drilling Hours: 18.0 Exp TD Date: 1/17/2011
Casing Data:
Type Size Weight Grade Connection Top Bottom Shoe Test
Conductor 14 5'
REECANAT I Ny -8B5n1b249%hNnNNA J-55 STC 481
'Sn\E | ve T 1o TNUTH A2 =TIV ILUJIT L JIJUUUU
Mud Properties: Drilling Parameters: BHA:
Type: Fresh water WOB: 20,000 Component Length 1D oD
Weight: 8.5 Tot RPM: 170 Smith MI616 PDC Bit 1.00'
Vis: 31 Torque: Hunting .33 Mud Motor 34.79
PV: P/U Wt: XO 3.03'
Y.BS Rot Wt: Monel 30.82'
10s Gels: S/O Wit: Gap sub 3.34'
10m Gels: Max Pull: Index 1.84'
pH: Avg Gas: XO 2.98'
API Filtrate: Max Gas: 17 6" DC's 495.53'
HPHT Filtrate: Cnx Gas:
Cake: Trip Gas:
Oil/H,0 Ratio:
ES: Surveys:
MBT: Depth inc Azi
Pm: 3,504 2.54° 239.31°
Pf/Mf: / 3,946' 2.42° 230.67°
% Solids: 4,295 2.46° 226.27° Total Length: B3
% LGS: 4,668 2.29° 219.42°
% Sand: 5,017 2.37° 210.19° Hydraulics:
LCM (ppb): 5,490" 2.42° 197.01° PP: 1500 HHP/in*: '/AV DP/DC:
Calcium: 6,028' 2.50° 209.93° GPM: 400 %P @ bit: SPR #1: 90-630
Chlorides: 6,355' 1.89° 209.09° TFA: Jet Vel: SPR #2:
Bit Info:
Bit # Size Make Type SIN Jets In Out Footage Hrs | ROP Grade
1 77/8" Smith MIB16 JE2564 6/16 438' 6,360' 5,922 72.0 82.2
Activity Summary (6:00am - 6:00am)
From To Hours| P /U |Summary
6:00 14:00 8.0 P Drill 7 7/8" hole F/ 4930 to 5498' w/ 20K WOB,TRPM-170,GPM-400,Avg ROP-71 ft/hr
14:00 14:30 0.5 P |Rig Service, set crownomatic
14:30 16:30 2.0 P Drill 7 7/8" hole F/ 5498' to 5687' w/ 20K WOB, TRPM-170,GPM-400,Avg ROP-95 ft/hr
16:30 17:30 1.0 U |Weld inside of drum, water spraying out,
17:30 1:30 8.0 P Drill 7 7/8" hole F/ 5687' to 6355' w/20KWOB, TRPM-170,GPM-400,Avg ROP-84 ft/hr
1:30 2:30 1.0 P |Circulate bottoms up to lay down for logs
2:30 4:30 2.0 P |Lay down drill pipe to 4000
4:30 5:00 0.5 P |Pump 260 bbls of 9.8 Ib brine water to kill flow
5:00 6:00 1.0 P Lay down drill pipe and BHA,
24 Hour Activity Summary:
Drill 7 7/8" hole F/ 4930' to 6355 w/20KWOB, TRPM-170,GPM-400,Avg ROP-79 ft/hr, rig service, set crownomatic, weld on inside of drum to fix leak,
LLay down drill pipe to 4000' , pump 260 bbls 9.8Ib brine, lay down drill pipe
24 Hour Plan Forward:
lay down drill pipe and BHA log w/ halliburton, test rams,run casing, cement
Safety Weather Fuel
Last BOP Test: 1/14/2011 BOP Drill? yes High / Low 40/ 25 Diesel Used: 1,257
BOP Test Press: 2000 Function Test? Conditions: clear Diesel Recvd: 0
Newfield Pers. 9 Incidents? None Wind: preezy to 20 mph Diesel on Loc: 5,653
Contract Pers. 1
RECEI VED: Apr. 13, 2015



NEWFIELD Well Name: STATE 6-36-8-15
Tk | Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 1/19/2011

> a ¥
T Present Ops: Wait on Completion
Field: GMBU CTBA1 Rig Name: NDSI #3 Report No: Daily 5
Location: S$36 T8S R15E KB: 12 Since Spud: 5
County: DUCHESNE Supervisor: Xabier Lasa 435-823-6014 AFE No: 19568
State: uT Supervisor 2: Daily Cost: 171,446
Elevation: 5761 Rig Phone: Cum. Cost: 382,205
Formation: GREEN RIVER Rig Email: Rig Release Date 01/19/11
Depth (MD): 6,355 PTD (MD): 6,320 Daily Footage: 0 Avg ROP:
Depth (TVD): 6,355' PTD (TVD): 6,320' Drilling Hours: 0.0 Exp TD Date: 1/17/2011
Casing Data:
Type Size Weight Grade Connection Top Bottom Shoe Test
Conductor 14 5'
Resfacannl | N ar 858501 boao3hnNnNA J-55 STC 481
(Production = = ] 542" TP TS T J-55 LTC 6,352'
Mud Properties: Drilling Parameters: BHA:
Type: Fresh water WOB: Component Length ID (0]s]
Weight: 8.5 Tot RPM: Smith MI616 PDC Bit 1.00'
Vis: 31 Torque: Hunting .33 Mud Motor 34.79'
PV: P/U Wt: XO 3.03
NS Rot Wt: Monel 30.82'
10s Gels: S/O Wt: Gap sub 3.34'
10m Gels: Max Pull: Index 1.84"
pH: Avg Gas: X0 2.98'
API Filtrate: Max Gas: 17 6" DC's 495.53'
HPHT Filtrate: Cnx Gas:
Cake: Trip Gas:
Qil/H,0 Ratio:
ES: Surveys:
MBT: Depth Inc Azi
Pm: 3,504 2.54° 239.31°
Pf/Mf: / 3,946' 2.42° 230.67°
% Solids: 4,295 2.46° 226.27° Total Length: DNSEs
% LGS: 4,668' 2.29° 219.42°
% Sand: 5,017 2.37° 210.19° Hydraulics:
LCM (ppb): 5,490' 2.42° 197.01° PP: HHP/in*: AV DP/DC:
Calcium: 6.028' 2.50° 209.93° GPM: %P @ bit: SPR #1: 90-630
Chlorides: 6,355' 1.89° 209.09° TFA: Jet Vel: SPR #2:
Bit Info:
Bit # Size Make Type SIN Jets in ~ Out Footage Hrs ROP Grade
1 77/8" Smith MI616 JE2564 6/16 438' 6,360 5,922 72.0 82.2 1-1-TD
Activity Summary (6:00am - 6:00am)
From To Hours| P /U |Summary
6:00 8:00 2.0 P |Lay down drill pipe and BHA , directional tools
8:00 19:00 11.0 P |Rig up Halliburton,Log f/6355' to surface,density,porosity,sonic wave,
19:00 19:30 0.5 P |Change rams test w/ B&C Quicktest to 2000#/10 minutes, tested good
19:30 23:00 3.5 P R/U QT Casing and run 151jts of 5.5",15.5#,J-55 set @ 6351.78', land w/ mandrill
23:00 1:00 2.0 P |Circulate
1:00 3:30 2.5 P |Cement w/300 sks of lead (PL 11+3%KCL+.05#SF+.5#CF+2%kol seal)@ 11ppg and 3.53 yield and 400 sks of
tail (50:50:2+3%KCL+.05#SF+.25#CF+.5%EC-1) mixed @ 14.4ppg and 1.24 yield, displaced w/ 150.5 bbls
of fresh, returned 20 bbls to pit,bump plug to 2276psi, BLM and State were notified via email of TD
3:30 6:00 2.5 P |Clean mud tanks
24 Hour Activity Summary:
Lay down drill pipe and Bha,R/U Halliburton and log, loggers TD-6355', change rams and test to 2000#/10 min. R/U QT Casing and run 151 jts 5.5"
set @ 6351.78", Cement w/ 300sks lead 400sks tail, returned 20 bbls to pit, clean mud tanks
24 Hour Plan Forward:
rig down and move rig
Safety Weather Fuel
Last BOP Test: 1/14/2011 BOP Drill? yes High / Low 35/10 Diesel Used: 999
BOP Test Press: 2000 Function Test? Yes Conditions: clear Diesel Recvd: 0
Newfield Pers. 9 incidents? None Wind: breezy Diesel on Loc: 4,554
Contract Pers. 18

RECEI VED: Apr. 13, 2015



NEWFIELD Well Name: STATE 6-36-8-15

ol . Final Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 1/20/2011

ROCKEY MOUNTAINS Present Ops: Wait on Completion
Field: GMBU CTBH1 Rig Name: NDS! #3 Report No: Daily 6
Location: S36 T8S R15E KB: 12 Since Spud: 6
County: DUCHESNE Supervisor: Xabier Lasa 435-823-6014 AFE No: 19568
State: uT Supervisor 2: Daily Cost: 6,675

Elevation: 5761 Rig Phone: Cum. Cost: 388,880
Formation: GREEN RIVER Rig Email: Rig Release Date 01/19/11
Depth (MD): 6,355 PTD (MD): 6,320 Daily Footage: 0 Avg ROP:
Depth (TVD): 6,355 PTD (TVD): 6,320 Drilling Hours: Exp TD Date: 1/17/2011
Casing Data:
Type Size Weight Grade Connection Top Bottom Shoe Test
Conductor 14 5'
mep .8 5/%3" 04 3342%%[\(\(\(* J-55 STC 481"
Production "5 1/ 5 J-55 LTC 6,352'
Mud Properties: Drilling Parameters: BHA:
Type: Fresh water WOB: Component Length 1D oD
Weight: 8.5 Tot RPM: Smith MI616 PDC Bit 1.00'
Vis: 31 Torque: Hunting .33 Mud Motor 34.79'
PV: P/U Wt: X0 3.03'
VAR Rot Wt: Monel 30.82'
10s Gels: S/I0 Wt: Gap sub 3.34'
10m Gels: Max Pull: Index 1.84'
pH: Avg Gas: XO 2.98'
API Filtrate: Max Gas: 17 6" DC's 495.53'
HPHT Filtrate: Cnx Gas:
Cake: Trip Gas:
Qil/H,0 Ratio:
ES: Surveys:
MBT: Depth Inc Azi
Pm: 3,504' 2.54° 239.31°
PfIMf: / 3,946' 2.42° 230.67°
% Solids: 4,295' 2.46° 226.27° Total Length: S/ S8
% LGS: 4,668’ 2.29° 219.42°
% Sand: 5,017 2.37° 210.19° Hydraulics:
LCM (ppb): 5,490’ 2.42° 197.01° PP: HHP/in": AV DP/DC:
Calcium: 6,028 2.50° 209.93° GPM: %P @ bit: SPR #1: 90-630
Chlorides: 6,355' 1.89° 209.09° TFA: Jet Vel: SPR #2:
Bit Info:

Bit # Size Make Type SIN Jets In Out Footage Hrs | ROP Grade

1 77/8" Smith MIG16 JE2564 6/16 438’ 6.360' 5,922' 72.0 82.2 1-1-TD

Activity Summary (6:00am - 6:00am)

From To Hours| P /U |[Summary

6:00 7:30 1.5 P |Rig down and prepare for rig move
Release Rig @ 07:30

24 Hour Activity Summary:
rig down prepare for rig move

24 Hour Plan Forward:
move rig to State 12-36-8-15 on 1-19-11.

Safety Weather Fuel

Last BOP Test: 1/14/2011 BOP Drili? no High / Low 30/15 Diesel Used: 254
BOP Test Press: 2000 Function Test? No Conditions: clear Diesel Recvd: 0
Newfield Pers. 9 Incidents? None Wind: breezy Diesel on Loc: 4,300
Contract Pers. 0

RECEI VED: Apr. 13, 2015



APl Well Nunber: 43013342290000
NEWFIELD PRODUCTION COMPANY - CASING & CEMENT REPORT
8 5/8" CASING SET AT 480.57
LAST CASING 14 SETAT 5 OPERATOR Newfield Exploration Company
DATUM 12 WELL STATE 6-36-8-15
DATUM TO CUT OFF CASING 12 FIELD/PROSPECT Monument Butte
DATUM TO BRADENHEAD FLANGE 12 CONTRACTOR & RIG # Ross #29
TD DRILLER 480 LOGGER
HOLE SIZE 12 1/4"
LOG OF CASING STRING:
PIECES oD ITEM - MAKE - DESCRIPTION WT/FT| GRD | THREAD| CONDT LENGTH

1 Wellhead A 1.42

11 8 5/8" |[Casing (shoe jt 43.05) 24 J-55 STC A 468.25

1 85/8" |Guide Shoe A 0.9
CASING INVENTORY BAL. FEET JTS TOTAL LENGTH OF STRING 470.57
TOTAL LENGTH OF STRING 470.57 11 LESS CUT OFF PIECE 2
LESS NON CSG. ITEMS 2.32 PLUS DATUM TO T/CUT OFF CSG 12
PLUS FULL JTS. LEFT OUT 0 CASING SET DEPTH 480.57

TOTAL 468.25 11
TOTAL CSG. DEL. (W/O THRDS) } COMPARE
TIMING
BEGIN RUN CSG. Spud| 4:00 PM | 12/23/2010 |GOOD CIRC THRU JOB Yes
CSG. IN HOLE 6:00 PM | 12/23/2010 |Bbls CMT CIRC TO SURFACE 5
BEGIN CIRC 1:12 PM 1/10/2011  |RECIPROCATED PIP _No
BEGIN PUMP CMT 1:23 PM 1/10/2011
BEGIN DSPL. CMT 1:39 PM 1/10/2011  |BUMPED PLUG TO 183
PLUG DOWN 1:48 PM 1/10/2011
RECEI VED: Apr. 13, 2015



APl Vel Nunber: 43013342290000

CEMENT USED CEMENT COMPANY- BJ
STAGE # SX CEMENT TYPE & ADDITIVES
1 220 Class "G"+2%CaCl Mixed @ 15.8ppg W/1.17yield Returned 5bbls to pit

CENTRALIZER & SCRATCHER PLACEMENT |

SHOW MAKE & SPACING
Middle of first, top of second and third for a total of three.

COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE Adam Ferrari DATE _ 1/10/2011

RECEI VED: Apr. 13, 2015



APl Wl | Nunber: 43013342290000
NEWFIELD PRODUCTION COMPANY - CASING & CEMENT REPORT
51/2" CASING SET AT 6351.78
LAST CASING 8 5/8" SETAT 481 OPERATOR Newfield Exploration Company
DATUM 12 WELL STATE 6-36-8-15
DATUM TO CUT OFF CASING 12 FIELD/PROSPECT Monument Butte
DATUM TO BRADENHEAD FLANGE 12 CONTRACTOR & RIG # NDSI# 3
TD DRILLER 6355 LOGC 6355
HOLE SIZE 7
LOG OF CASING STRING:
PIECES OD ITEM - MAKE - DESCRIPTION WT/FT GRD THREAD CONDT LENGTH
1 51/2" [Landing jt. 15.5 J-55 LTC A 16
150 51/2" |LT&C Casing 15.5 J-55 LTC a 6303.78

1 5 1/2" |Float collar A 1.5

1 51/2" |LT&C Casing 15.5 J-55 LTC A 33

1 51/2" |Guide shoe A 1.5
CASING INVENTORY BAL. FEET JTS TOTAL LENGTH OF STRING 6355.78
TOTAL LENGTH OF STRING 6355.78 LESS CUT OFF PIECE 16
LESS NON CSG. ITEMS 19 PLUS DATUM TO T/CUT OFF CSG 12
PLUS FULL JTS. LEFT OUT 42.73 1 CASING SET DEPTH 6,351.78

TOTAL 6379.51 1
TOTAL CSG. DEL. (W/O THRDS) 6379.51 152 } COMPARE
TIMING
BEGIN RUN CSG. Spud| 7:30 PM 1/18/2011  |GOOD CIRC THRU JOB Yes
CSG. INHOLE 11:00 PM 1/18/2011  |Bbls CMT CIRC TO SURFACE 20
BEGIN CIRC 11:00 PM 1/18/2011 RECIPROCATED PIP __No
BEGIN PUMP CMT 1:30 AM 1/19/2011
BEGIN DSPL. CMT 2:30 AM 1/19/2011 BUMPED PLUG TO 2276
PLUG DOWN 2:52 AM 1/19/2011
RECEI VED: Apr. 13, 2015



APl Wel |l Nunber: 43013342290000
CEMENT USED CEMENT COMPANY- Bj Services
STAGE # SX CEMENT TYPE & ADDITIVES
1 300 [PL I1+3%KCL+054SF+54CF+2%kol seal
2 400 [50:50:2+3%KCL+05#SF -+ 25#CF+5%EC-1

CENTRALIZER & SCRATCHER PLACEMENT l

SHOW MAKE & SPACING

Middlde of first, top of second and third then every third for a total of 20.

COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE Xabier Lasa

DATE  1/19/2011

RECEI VED: Apr .

13, 2015
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