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QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
T9S, Ri5E, S.L.B.&M. Well location, GD #16G-35-9-15, located as

shown in the SE 1/4 SE 1/4 of Section 35,
T9S, R15E, S.L.B.&M., Duchesne County, Utah.NB9°59'50"E

- 2642.20' (Meas.) NB9°55'25"E
- 26J4.44' (Meas.)

BASIS OF ELEVATION1910 Brass Cap, 1910 Brass Cap, 1910 Brass Cap,
2 µ¡ Two 0.9' High 2.0 High, PH' BENCH MARK M76 LOCATED IN THE SW 1/4 NE 1/4 OF

SECTION 27, T9S, R15E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE MYTON
SW QUADRANGLE,UTAH, DUCHESNE COUNTY 7.5 MINUTE QUAD.
(TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICALSURVEY. SAID
ELEVATIONIS MARKED AS BEING 6491 FEET.

BASIS OF BEARINGS
BASIS OF BEARINGSIS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.

1910 Brass Cap,

L1910
Brass 35 10' H/gh

Cap 1.0' High

o
°o

o

CA
CERT 4

THIS IS TO CERTIFYTHAT TH AT WAS FROM
FIELDNOTES OF ACTUALS A S'y MY
SUPERVISIONAND THAT TH TRU TO THE
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEA B

GO /16G- J5-9- 15
E/ev. Ungraded Ground = 6361' 6

1910 Brass Cap, Îo R lUll
1.7' High, P//e STA agga
of Startes

1910 Bras Cap. SB9°59'0J"W
- 2632.30' (Meas.) SB9°58'09"W

- 2634.18' (Meas.) var ,, c, UmuH ENGINEERING & IAND SURVEYING';,'s Pile 1.5' . Hgh 85 SOUTH 200 BAST - VERNAL UTAH 84078(AUTONOMOUS NAD 83)
(435) 789-1017LEGEND· LATITUDE = 39°58'53.67" (39.981575)'

SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:LONGITUDE =
110°11'31.93" (110.192203) 1" =

1000° 09-14-07 10-10-07=
90° SYMBOL (AUTONOMOUS NAD 27) PARTY REFERENCES

= PROPOSED WELLHEAD· LATITUDE=
39°58'53.80" (39.981611) D.A. T.A. S.L. G.L.O. PLAT

A = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGITUDE= 110°11'29.38" (110.191494) WEATHER FILE
WARM QUESTAR EXPLR.&



Additional Operator Remarks

Questar Exploration & Production Company proposes to drill a well to 5,900' to test the Green River
formation. If productive, casing will be run and the wellcompleted. If dry, the well will be plugged and
abandoned as per BLMand State of Utah requirements".

See attached Onshore Order No. 1

See attached Multi-Point Surface Use & Operations Plan

Please be advised that Questar Exploration & Production Company agrees to be responsible under
the terms and conditions of the lease for the operations conducted upon the lease lands.

Bond coverage for thiswell is provided by Bond No.ESBOOOO24. The principal is Questar Exploration
& Production Company via surety as consent as provided for the 43 CFR



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION
GD 16G-35-9-15

DRILLING PROGRAM

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore

Federal Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made
with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas No. 1, and the approved
plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy
of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

1. Formation Tops

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth
Uinta Surface
Green River 2,422'
TD 5,900'

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil Gas Water and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas. Or
other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation Depth
Oil Green River 2,422'

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling, will be
recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested to
determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal, Utah.
Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If flows are detected, samples will
be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses conducted. Fresh water will be
obtained from Wonsits Valley water right # A36125 (which was filed on May 7, 1964,) or
Red Wash water right # 49-2153 (which was filed on March 25, 1960). It was determined
by the Fish and Wildlife Service that any water right number filed before1989 is not
depleting to the Upper Colorado River System, to supply fresh water for drilling
purposes. All water resulting from drilling operations will be disposed of at Red Wash
Central Battery Disposal Site; SWSE, Section 27, T7S, R23E or Wonsits Valley Disposal
Site; SWNW, Section 12, T8S,



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION
GD 16G-35-9-15

DRILLING PROGRAM

3. Operator's Specification for Pressure Control Equipment:

A. 3,000 psi double gate and 3,000 psi annular BOP (schematic attached.

B. Functional test daily

C. All casing strings shall be pressure tested (0.22psi/foot or 1500 psi, whichever is
greater) prior to drilling the plug after cementing; test pressure shall not exceed
the internal yield pressure of the casing.

D. Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved stack
working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 50 percent of internal yield pressure
of casing whichever is less. BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimum
requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 for equipment and testing
requirements, procedures, etc..., for a 3M system and individual components shall
be operable as designed.

4. Casing Design:

Hole Csg. Top Bottom Wt. Grade Thread Cond.
Size Size (MD) (MD)

17-1/2"" 14" sfc 40' Steel Cond. None Used

12-1/4" 9-5/8" sfc 4,50' 36.0 J-55 STC New

7-7/8" 5-1/2" sfc 5,900' 15.5 J-55 LTC New

Casing Strengths: Collapse Burst Tensile
(minimum)

9-5/8" 36.0 lb. J-55 STC 2,020 psi 3,520 psi 394,000 lb.

5-1/2" 15.5 lb. J-55 LTC 4,040 psi 4,810 psi 217,000 lb.

MINIMUM DESIGN FACTORS:

COLLAPSE: 1.125
BURST: 1.10
TENSION: 1.80

Area Fracture Gradient: 0.7 psi/foot
Maximum anticipated mud weight: 9.5 ppg
Maximum surface treating pressure: 4,000



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION
GD 16G-35-9-15

DRILLING PROGRAM

5. Auxiliary Equipment

A. Kelly Cock - yes

B. Float at the bit - no

C. Monitoring equipment on the mud system - visually and/or PVT/Flow Show

D. Full opening safety valve on the rig floor - yes

E. Rotating Head - yes

If drilling with air the following will be used:

F. The blooie line shall be at least 6" in diameter and extend at least 100' from the
well bore into the reserve/blooie pit.

G. Blooie line ignition shall be provided by a continuous pilot (ignited when drilling
below 500').

H. Compressor shall be tied directly to the blooie line through a manifold.

I. A mister with a continuous stream of water shall be installed near the end of the
blooie lines for dust suppression.

Surface hole will be drilled with air, air/mist, foam, or mud depending on hole conditions.
Drilling below surface casing will be with water based drilling fluids consisting primarily
of fresh water, bentonite, lignite, caustic, lime, soda ash and polymers. No chromates will
be used. It is not intended to use oil in the mud, however, in the event it is used, oil
concentration will be less than 4% by volume. Maximum anticipated mud weight is 9.5
ppg.

No minimum quantity of weight material will be required to be kept on location.

PVT/Flow Show will be used from base of surface casing to TD.

Gas detector will be used from surface casing depth to TD.

6. Testing, logging and coring program

A. Cores - none anticipated

B. DST - none



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION
GD 16G-35-9-15

DRILLING PROGRAM

C. Logging - Mud logging - 2000' to TD
GR-SP-Induction, Neutron Density

D. Formation and Completion Interval: Green River intervals, final determination of
completion will be made by analysis of logs.
Stimulation - Stimulation will be designed for the particular area of interest as
encountered.

7. Cementing Program

14" Conductor:
Cement to surface with construction cement.

9-5/8" Surface Casing: sfc - 450' (MD)
Lead/Tail Slurry: 0' - 450'. 160 sks (290 cu ft) Rockies LT cement + 0.25 lb/sk Kwik
Seal + 0.125 lb/sk Poly-E-Flake. Slurry wt: 13.5 ppg, Slurry yield: 1.81 n3/sk,Slurry
volume: 12-1/4" hole + 100% excess.

5-1/2" Production Casing: sfc - 5,900' (MD)
Lead Slurry: 0' - 2,000'. 120 sks (460 cu ft) Halliburton Hi-Fill cement + 0.125 lb/sk
Poly-E-Flake. Slurry wt: 11.0 ppg, Slurry yield: 3.84 ft3/sk, Slurry volume: 7-7/8" hole +

25% excess in open hole section.
Tail Slurry: 2,000' - 5,900'. 680 sks (845 cu ft) 50/50 Poz Premium + 0.6% Halad (R)-
322 fluid loss + 2.0% Microbond M expander + 0.125 lb/sk Poly-E-Flake. Slurry wt:
14.35 ppg, Slurry yield: 1.24 n3/sk,Slurry volume: 7-7/8" hole + 25% excess.

*Final cement volumes to be calculated from caliper log with an attempt to be made to
circulate cement to the surface on the production string. A bond log will be run across the
zone of interest and across zones as required by the authorized officer to insure protection
of natural resources.

8. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential Hazards

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No H2S has been encountered in
or known to exist from previous wells drilled to similar depths in the general area.
Maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure equals approximately 2,900 psi. Maximum
anticipated bottom hole temperature is 140°



• .

DRILLINGPROGRAM

SCHEMATICDIAGRAMOF3,000PSIBOPSTACK

ORILLING NIPPLE

e

..cw am:

NYCRIL

ELINC MMS

PtPE MMs

SPOOL
MILL LINE

CMCME LINE

MEAD

ee

\ ..a m morenn.acas -sspanica

,

FR fxTS *$7 GC

N.ES UNE 18 MT att .
....2×1

-\ **5 t
locau. 3" noseum.ca a .

e •

••



A CON22NUED
.

e

MILE ONOKE

MAMFOLDEQi.RPRIElif...-

nav v

e

e

a

s'e
ae

e

a

12

e

e



QUESTAR EXÊLORATION & PRODUCTION COMÈANY
GD 16G-35-9-15

515' FSL 604' FEL
SESE, SECTION 35, T9S, R15E

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH
LEASE # UTU-78021

MULTI-POINT SURFACE USE & OPERATIONS PLAN

An on-site inspection was conducted for the GD 16G-35-9-15 on November 7, 2007.
Weather conditions were cool and sunny at the time of the onsite. In attendance at the
inspection were the following individuals:

Paul Buhler Bureau of Land Management
Amy Torres Bureau of Land Management
Jan Nelson Questar Exploration & Production Company
Raymond Pallesen Questar Exploration & Production Company
Don AIIred Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying

1. Existinq Roads:

Questar Exploration & Production Company will access the area of development
using existing Duchesne county roads. Primary access will be from the town of
Myton, traveling approximately 20 miles southwest on county road 32 (Wells
Draw Road).

Refer to Topo Maps A and B for location of access roads within a 2-mile radius.

There will be no improvements made to existing roads.

2. Planned Access Roads:

New access roads on BLM surface will be crowned (2 to 3%), ditched, and
constructed with a running surface of 18 feet and a maximum disturbed width of 30
feet. Any additional disturbance required due to intersections or sharp curves will
be discussed at the on-site and approved by the BLM/VFO AO. Graveling or
capping the roadbed will be performed as necessary to provide a well constructed,
safe road. Surface disturbance and vehicular trafficwill be limited to the approved
location and access route or, as proposed by the Operator. Prior to construction or
upgrading, the proposed road shall be cleared of any snow and allowed to dry
completely.

Access roads and surface disturbing activities will conform to standards outlined in
the BLM and Forest Service publication: Surface Operatinq Standards for Oil and
gas Exploration and Development, Fourth Edition 2006.
The road surface and shoulders will be kept in a safe and usable condition and will
be maintained in accordance with the original construction standards. All drainage
ditches and culverts will be kept clear and free-flowing and will be maintained
according to original construction standards. The access road disturbed area will
be kept free of trash during operations. AIItrafficwillbe confined to the approved
road running surface. Road drainage crossings shall be of the typicaldry



drainage crossing type. Crossings shall be designed so they will not cause excess
siltation or accumulation of debris in the drainage nor shall the drainage be blocked
by the roadbed. If culverts are needed, the location and size of the culverts will be
proposed during the on-site. The operator will clean and maintain approved
culverts as needed. Erosion of drainage ditches by runoff water shall be prevented
by diverting water off at frequent intervals by means of cutouts. Should mud holes
develop, the holes shall be filled in and detours around the holes avoided. When
snow is removed from the road during the winter months, the snow should be
pushed outside of the borrow ditches, and the turnouts kept clear so that snowmelt
will be channeled away from the road.

Refer to Topo Map B for the location of the proposed access road.

3. Location of Existinq Wells Within a 1-Mile Radius:

A map will be provided with the site-specific APD showing the location of existing
wells within a one mile radius.

Please refer to Topo map C.

4. Location of Existinq and Proposed Facilities:

Please refer to Topo map D.

No pipeline will be required for this location.

The following guidelines will apply if the well is productive.

• A containment dike will be constructed completely around those production
facilities which contain fluids (i.e., production tanks, produced water tanks).
These dikes will be constructed of compacted impervious subsoil; hold
110% of the capacity of the largest tank; and, be independent of the back
cut. If a Spill Prevention, Control, and Countermeasure (SPCC) Plan is
required by the Environmental Protection Agency, the containment dike may
be expanded to meet SPCC requirements with approval by the BLM/VFO
AO. The specific APD will address additional capacity if such is needed due
to environmental concerns. The use of topsoilfor the construction of dikes
will not be allowed.

• All loading lines will be placed inside the berm surrounding the tank
batteries.

• AII permanent (on site six months or longer) above the ground structures
constructed or installed, including pumping units, will be painted Olive Black
(#5WA20-6) color as approved by the BLM/VFO AO.

AII facilities will be painted within six months of installation. Facilities
required to comply with the Occupational Safety and Health Act (OSHA) will
be excluded. The required color is Olive Black (#5WA20-6) unless the
BLM/VFO AO determines that another color shall be



Surface pipelines willbe constructed in accordance with the following guidance. A
description of the proposed pipeline will be included as part of the site-specific
APD.
• Gas: The pipeline will be unpainted steel, 4" inside diameter, welded,

schedule #20 or greater, unless noted in the APD. The pipeline will be
welded together on location and pulled into place. The pipeline will lay
within 20 feet of existing roads, pipelines, or existing route authorizations as
much as possible. Pipeline route alternatives will be discussed at the on-
site and the resulting proposal will be described in the APD. Road
crossings will have a steel casing installed over the pipeline and ramped so
the pipeline will not be buried. Pipeline Route Authorizations will be 20'
wide and the location noted on maps accompanying the APD. No grading
will be allowed unless it is proposed in the APD.

• Oil: The pipeline will be steel, welded, schedule #40 or greater, and consist
of (1) 3" inside diameter oil line, one (1) 2" inside diameter oil line and two
(2) 1 1/4" inside diameter trace lines. The pipelines will be welded together
on location and pulled separately into place. The lines will be banded
together in one (1) bundle, insulated, and covered with tin painted Olive
Black. The pipeline will lay within 20 feet of existing roads, pipelines, or
existing route authorizations as much as possible. Pipeline route
alternatives will be discussed at the on-site and the resulting proposal will
be described in the APD. Road crossings will have a steel casing installed
over the pipeline and ramped so the pipeline will not be buried. Pipeline
Route Authorizations will be 20' wide and the location noted on maps
accompanying the APD. No grading will be allowed unless it is proposed in
the APD.

• Fuel Gas: The pipeline will be a 2" inside diameter, poly pipe with a rating
of 160 psi or greater. The line will be laid adjacent to the oil or gas lines
following the lines to the location. Pipeline route alternatives will be
discussed at the on-site and the resulting proposal will be described in the
APD.

5. Location and Tvoe of Water Supolv:

Fresh water will be obtained from Wonsits Valley water right # A36125 (which was
filed on May 7, 1964,) or Red Wash water right # 49-2153 (which was filed on March
25, 1960). It was determined by the Fish and Wildlife Service that any water right
number filed before1989 is not depleting to the Upper Colorado River System, to
supply fresh water for drilling purposes.

6. Source of Construction Materials:

Surface and subsoil materials in the immediate area will be utilized.

Any gravel will be obtained from a commercial



The use of materials under BLMjurisdictionwill conform with 43 CFR 3610.2-3.

7. Methods of Handlinq Waste Materials:

Drillcuttings willbe contained and buried in the reserve pit.

Drilling fluids including salts and chemicals, will be contained in the reserve pit.
Upon terminationof drilling and completion operations, the liquid contents of the
reserve pit will be used at the next drill site or will be removed and disposed of at
an approved waste disposal facility within 120 days after drilling is terminated.
Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons in the pit shall be removed in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-1.

Unless specified in the site specific APD, the reserve pit will be constructed on the
location and will not be located within natural drainages, where a flood hazard
exists or surface runoff will destroy or damage the pit walls. The reserve pit will be
constructed so that it will not leak, break, or allow discharge of liquids.

It was determined at the on-site inspection that a pit liner is necessary, the reserve
pit will be lined with a synthetic reinforced liner, a minimum of 20 millimeters thick,
with sufficient bedding used to cover any rocks. The liner willoverlap the pit walls
and be covered with dirt and/or rocks to hold it in place. No trash or scrap will be
disposed of in the pit.

Reserve pit leaks are considered an undesirable event and will be orally reported
to the AO.

After first production, produced wastewater will be confined to the approved pit or
storage tank for a period not to exceed 90 days. During the 90 day period, in
accordance with Onshore Order # 7, all produced water will be contained in tanks
on location and then hauled to Wonsits Valley water injection station located in the
SWNW Section 12, T8S, R21E; or, the Red Wash disposal well located in the
NESW, Section 28, T7S, R22E; or, the Red Wash Central Battery Disposal located
in SWSE, Section 27, T7S, R23E, or third-partysurface evaporative pits.

Pit reclamation willbe accomplished using the following procedures:

• Lined pits: Free liquids will be removed to the focus area hauling -- designated
on the GD 8G-34-9-15 Central Battery enlarged reserve pit where enhanced
evaporation system will be used. Liners willbe ruptured when emptied to allow
the remaining liquid to be adequately mixed and to promote additional drying of
the pit area.

Produced water, oil, and other byproducts will not be applied to roads or well pads
for control of dust or weeds. The dumping of produced fluids on roads, well sites,
or other areas will not be allowed.

Any spills of oil, gas, salt water, or other noxious fluids will be immediately cleaned
up and removed to an approved disposal site. The spills will be reported to the AO
and other authorities as



A chemical porta-toilet will be furnished with the drilling rig. The chemical porta-
toiletwastes will be hauled to Ashley Valley Sewer and Water System for disposal.

Garbage, trash, and other waste materials will be collected in a portable, self-
contained, fully enclosed trash cage during operations. Trash willnot be burned
on location. AIIdebris and other waste material not contained in the trash cage will
be cleaned up and removed from the location immediately after removal of the
drilling rig. All trash and waste material will be hauled to the Uintah County
Landfill.

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA Title III (hazardous materials) in an
amount greater than 10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored, transported,or
disposed of annually in association with the drilling, testing, or completing of wells.
Furthermore, extremely hazardous substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in
threshold planning quantities, will not be used, produced, stored, transported, or
disposed of in association with the drilling, testing, or completing of wells within
these areas. Specific APD's shall address any modifications from this policy.

8. Ancillary Facilities:

This will be an independent well location. Product will be contained in two 500 bbl
tanks and then transportedfrom location to delivery site.

9. Well Site Layout:

A Location Layout Diagram describing drill pad cross-sections, cuts and fills, and
locations of mud tanks, reserve pits, flare pit, pipe racks, trailerparking, spoil dirt
stockpile(s), and the surface material stockpile(s) will be included with the site
specific APD.

Please see the attached diagram rig orientation, parking areas, and access roads,
as well as the location of the following:

• The reserve pit.

• The stockpiled topsoil (first six inches), will not be used for facility
berms. All brush removed from the well pad during construction will
be stockpiled with the topsoil.

• The flare pit or flare box will be located downwind from the prevailing
wind direction.

• Any drainage that crosses the well location will be diverted around
the location by using ditches, water diversion drains or berms. If
deemed necessary at the on-site, erosion drains may be installed to
contain sediments that could be produced from access roads and
well



10. Fencinq Requirements:

Each existing fence to be crossed by an access road shall be braced and tied off
before cutting the wire. A 16 foot cattleguard will then be installed. The
cattleguard willbe installed on permanent concrete or treated timberbases. QEP
will assume the maintenance of all such cattleguards.

Any open pits will be fenced during the operations. The fencing will be maintained
until such timeas the pits are backfilled.

AIIpits will be fenced according to the following minimum standards:

• 39 inch net wire will be used with at least one strand of barbed wire
on top of the net wire. Barbed wire is not necessary if pipe or some
type of reinforcement rod is attached to the top of the entire fence.

• The net wire shall be no more than two inches above the ground.
The barbed wire shall be three inches over the net wire. Total height
of the fence shall be at least 42 inches.

• Corner posts shall be cemented and/or braced in such a manner to
keep the fence tightat all times.

• Standard steel, wood, or pipe posts shall be used between the corner
braces. Maximum distance between any 2 fence posts shall be no
greater than 16 feet.

• All wire shall be stretched using a stretching device before it is
attached to corner posts.

• The reserve pit will be fenced on three (3) sides during drilling
operations. The fourth side willbe put in place when the rig moves
off location. The pit will be fenced and maintained until it is
backfilled. If drilling operations does not commence within 3 days,
the fourth side of the fence will be installed.

11. Reclamation Plan:

Long-Term Reclamation

Long-term reclamation will be conducted on all disturbed areas no longer required for field
operations. This includes unnecessary portions of the well pads after completion and
throughout the well's production period, road outslopes, and pipeline corridors. Long-
term reclamation will be conducted on pads and roads for non-producing wells and on
pads for wells that have reached the end of their productive life (includes facility removal
and complete well pad and access road reclamation). Because long-term reclamation will
occur throughoutthe life of the project, this plan does not differentiate between "interim"
and "final" reclamation. AII long-term reclamation is considered final unless monitoring
shows the need for additional reclamation action. Long-term reclamation will return as
much of the well pad as possible to its predisturbance condition as quickly as



Long-term reclamation will increase habitat patch sizes and reduce habitat fragmentation
for sagebrush obligate species.

Temporary Reclamation, Soil Stabilization, and Erosion Control

Topsoil that will be stored more than 2 years before long-term reclamation begins will be
stabilized and windrowed, where possible, to a depth of 2 -- 3 feet at a specified location
near the margin of the well site as determined at the on-site inspection.

• Windrowed topsoilwill then be broadcast-seeded with an approved seed mixture
and raked or dragged with a chain, immediately after windrowing.

• Other erosion control techniques will be applied where necessary and may
include:

o diversion ditch design and construction
o sediment control basin design and construction
o straw or hay bale check dams
o rock check dams
o sediment fence
o energy dissipaters

AIIrunoff and erosion control structures will be inspected, maintained, and cleaned-out by
the Operator on a regular basis throughoutthe life of the project. Inspections will occur
after runoff events (e.g., spring runoff, storm events).

Topsoil and Spoil Handlinq

Topsoil will be salvaged from all proposed disturbance areas and stockpiled separately
from subsoil materials. Topsoil salvaged from the reserve pit will be stockpiled separately
near the reserve pit.

Topsoil stockpiles will be adequately protected until replaced on the surface during
reclamation. Temporary erosion control measures such as temporaryvegetation cover,
application of mulch, netting, or soil stabilizers may be used in some areas to minimize
wind and water erosion and sedimentation prior to vegetation establishment.

Surface Preparation

Backfilling, Gradinq, and Contourinq

Areas to be reclaimed will be graded to approximate originalcontours and to blend in with
adjacent topography. Area-wide drainage will be restored so that surface runoff flows and
gradients are returned to the condition present prior to development. Graded surfaces
will be suitable for the replacement of a uniform depth of topsoil,will promote cohesion
between subsoil and topsoil layers, will reduce wind erosion, and will facilitate moisture
capture. Specialized grading techniques may be applied, if warranted, and could include
slope rounding, bench grading, stair-step grading/terracing, and/or contour furrowing.

Dozers, loaders, scrapers, and motor graders are typicallyused for backfilling and



Reserve Pit Evaporation

After the well has been completed and is put into production, the reserve pit will be
evaporated. Depending on the time of year and precipitation accumulations, the reserve
pit may evaporate naturally. If the reserve pit will not evaporate naturally within one
summer season (i.e., June - August) after drilling is completed, alternative evaporation
techniques may be applied. Some alternative techniques may include:

• Trickle Systems
• Evaporation Misters and Aerators
• Evaporation Ponds (withapproved regulatory filings)
• Pit Solidification
• Water Hauling

o Haul non-reusable water to an approved disposal facility.
o Haul or polypipe re-useable water to another reserve pit to be used in the

drilling process; water filters may be used if necessary.
o Focus area hauling - Designate one slightlyenlarged reserve pit in a focus

area to be used as the evaporation pit for 23 other wells; haul or polypipe
non-reusable drilling water within the focus area to the designated pit to be
evaporated. This willfacilitate rapid pit closure and reclamation on all other
well pads within the focus area.

Once the reserve pit is as dry as possible, all debris in the pit will be removed. Excess pit
liner will be cut off and removed and the remaining liner will be torn and perforated while
backfilling the pit. The liner will be buried to a minimum of 4 feet deep. The reserve pit
will be backfilled and recontoured to blend with the natural landscape. The reserve pit will
be crowned convexly to allow for settling and prevent standing water.

Ripping and Discina

Compacted areas such as roads and well pads willbe ripped to a depth of 12 - 18 inches
to improve soil aeration, water infiltration, and root penetration. Ripped areas will be
disced, if necessary, to fill in deep furrows (where topsoilwould be lost) and break up
large clods (towhich topsoilwill not adhere).

Motor graders or tractors equipped with ripping shanks are typicallyused for ripping.
Ripper shanks will be set approximately 1 - 2 feet apart. Discing is typically
accomplished using a tractor-drawndisc set 2 - 6 inches deep.

Seedbed Preparation

Seedbed preparation maximizes seeding efficiency and improves reclamation success. It
includes topsoil replacement and various cultivation techniques. Cultivation techniques
may include one or more of the following:

• plowing
• chisel plowing
• discing
•



• rotary hoeing
• harrowing
• cultipacking
• extreme surface roughening
• pitting

Topsoil Replacement

Waterbars and erosion control devices will be installed on reclaimed areas prior to topsoil
replacement, as necessary, to control topsoil erosion. Stockpiled topsoil will be
redistributed uniformlyon areas to be reclaimed.

Topsoil is typicallyreplaced using scrapers, dozers, and/or motorgraders.

Revegetation

Seeding

Once the topsoil is replaced, seeding will occur generally between September 15 and
freeze-up. If fall seeding is not feasible, seeding may occur between spring thaw and
May 15. Seeding will not be applied to wet or frozen ground. In this circumstance,
seeding will take place when the ground dries or thaws to the point where soils are friable.

Reclaimed areas will be seeded with seed mixtures that will restore disturbed sites so that
they closely resemble pre-disturbance plant communities. Seed mixtures will be
developed based on the following criteria: general conditions within the analysis area,
species adaptations to site condition, usefulness of the species for rapid site stabilization,
species success in past revegetation efforts, and seed costs and availability.

The seed mixture and seeding rates willbe recommended by the BLM authorized officer
(AO) at the on-site inspection and included in the Application for Permit to Drill (APD) or
Right-of-Way (ROW). Alternative species and seeding rates may be used at the
Operator's discretion with BLM approval, if warranted by site-specific conditions or seed
availability, provided that the alternative species/seeding rates facilitate achieving
reclamation success and all modifications are documented.

Seed mixtures will be certified weed-free.

Seed will be drilled on the contour to an appropriate depth. When drill-seeding is not
practical due to steep slopes or rocky surfaces, seeding rates would be doubled, seed
would be broadcast, and the area would be raked, "walked" with tracked equipment, or
dragged with a chain or harrow to cover seed.

Mulching

Dry mulch may be considered as one method to enhance the reestablishment of desired
plant communities. Where mulching is deemed appropriate, the reclaimed area will be
uniformly mulched with certified weed-free grass, hay, small grain straw, wood fiber,
and/or live mulch at a rate of 1.5 - 2 tonslacre. Alternatively, cotton, jute, or synthetic
netting could be applied. Mulch will be crimped into the soil, tackified,or incorporated



erosion control blankets to prevent it from blowing or washing away and from entering
waterways. Mulch will protect the soil from wind and water erosion, raindrop impact, and
surface runoff and will help to hold seeds in place.

Alternative mulching techniques may be considered on steep slopes where it is unsafe to
operate equipment, at sites where soils have 35 percent or more surface rock content, or
on notably unstable areas. Alternative techniques may include hydromulch,
biodegradable erosion control netting, or matting and will be firmly attached to the
surface.

Monitoring

QEP will work with the BLM to monitor the success of interim and final reclamation. QEP
will monitor the success of reclamation with documentation for 3 years. If QEP and an
authorized officer for the BLM determine the reclamation has not been successful after
the second growing season, QEP will take remedial action.

Debris
Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area will be cleared of all
unused tubing,materials, trash, and debris not required for production.

Weed Control

The Operator will be responsible for noxious and invasive weed control from all project
activities for the life of project. If use of herbicides is deemed necessary by Operators, a
Pesticide Use Permit will be submitted for approval to the BLM. Herbicides will be used
only in the season or growth stage during which they are most effective. Herbicides will
be applied only by certified personnel using approved precautionary and application
procedures in compliance with all applicable federal, state, and local regulations.
Herbicides will not be used within 100 feet of open water or during extremely windy
conditions. Aerial application of herbicides will be prohibited within 0.25 mile of known
special status plant species locations and hand application of herbicides will not occur
within 500 feet of such occurrences. Certified weed-free seed mixtures and mulches will
be used, thereby minimizingthe potential for noxious weed introduction.
Mowing may be considered as an alternative to herbicide applications. Mowing would be
implemented prior to seed head establishment or bloom.

Halogeton (Halogeton glomeratus) is of particular concern to many land managers.
Halogeton, a summer annual, was introduced into North America as late as 1930 and has
rapidly spread becoming a serious rangeland weed. It has become common in dry
deserts, barren areas, overgrazed prairies, roadsides, and other disturbed areas where
native vegetation has been removed. Dense stands are found on burned-over areas,
overgrazed ranges, dry lakebeds, roadsides, and abandoned dry farms. Halogeton
cannot compete with desirable forage. Consistent monitoring and control techniques will
facilitate rapid revegetation of desirable forage thereby reducing the spread of Halogeton.

A weed control program will be applied to all existing and proposed access roads,
pipeline ROWs, and well pads. Weed control involves annual treatments that are
monitored and continued until desirable vegetation out-competes invasive or noxious



Dry Hole/Abandoned Location

On lands administered by the BLM, abandoned well sites, roads, and other disturbed
areas will be restored as near as practical to their original condition. Where applicable,
these conditions may include the reestablishment of irrigation systems; reestablishment of
appropriate soil conditions; and, the reestablishment of vegetation as specified.

AII disturbed surfaces will be recontoured to approximate natural contours, with
reclamation of the well pad and access road to be performed as soon as practical after
final abandonment.

At final abandonment, the Operator will cap the casing with a metal plate a minimum of
0.25 inch thick. The cap will be welded in place and the well location and identity will be
permanently inscribed on the cap. The cap will be constructed with a weep hole. The
depth of the permanent cap will be determined at the time of final abandonment. Long-
term reclamation will then be applied and willfollow the reclamation process described in
this plan. When reclamation is deemed successful by the Operator and the BLM, the
Operator willrequest a bond release.

SEED MIX:

Interim Reclamation:
6 lbs Crested Wheat Grass
6 Ibs Needle & Thread

Final Reclamation:
Seed Mix # 6
3 lbs Wyoming Big Sage Brush, 3 lbs Shad scale, 3 lbs Indian Rice Grass, 4 lbs Crested
Wheat Grass

12. Surface Ownership:

The well pad and access road are located on lands owned by:
Bureau of Land Management
170 South 500 East
Vernal, UT 84078
(435) 781-4400

13. Other Information:

Drilling rigs and/or equipment used during drilling operations will not be stacked or
stored on Federal lands on BLM administered lands after the conclusion of drilling
operations or at any other time without authorization by the BLM/VFO Authorized
Officer. If BLM authorization is obtained, such storage is only a temporary



A Class III archeological survey was conducted by Montgomery Archaeology
Consultants. A copy of the report was submitted directly to the appropriate
agencies by Montgomery Archaeology Consultants. Cultural resource clearance
has been recommended for this project. If these surveys identify areas with a high
probability of encountering potentially significant subsurface archaeological sites,
QEP would provide a qualified archaeologist to monitor surface disturbance. If
historic or archaeological materials are uncovered during construction, the
Operator is to immediately stop work that might further disturb such materials and
contact the Authorized Officer.

A paleontological survey was conducted by Intermountain Paleo Consulting. A
copy of this report was submitted directly to the appropriate agencies by Stephen
D. Sandau. The inspection for this project resulted in no signs of vertebrate fossils.
Nevertheless, if any vertebrate fossils(s) are found during construction within the
project area, QEP will report all occurrences of paleontological resources
discovered to a geologist with the Vernal Field Office of the BLM.

There is a Deer and Elk Winter Range Stipulation from December 1st to April 30th.
No construction or drilling will commence during this period unless otherwise
determined by a wildlife biologist that the site is inactive.

There is a Golden Eagle Stipulation from February 1"*to July 15th. No construction
or drilling will commence during this period unless otherwise determined by a
wildlife biologist that the site is inactive.

There is a Red Tail Hawk Stipulation from April 1"' July 15th. No construction or
drilling willcommence during this period unless otherwise determined by a wildlife
biologist that the site is inactive.

A suitable mufflerwill be installed on pumping unit to help reduce noise control.

Stock pile trees, mulch and respread over the location during interim reclamation.

Install culvert at the approach of the road.

Ditch location after pit is closed.

Do not move existing main



Lessee's or Operator's Representative:

Jan Nelson
Red Wash Rep.

Questar Exploration & Production Company
11002 East 17500 South

Vernal, Utah 84078
(435) 781-4331

Certification:

AIIlease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil & Gas Orders, the approved

plan of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees.

Questar Exploration & Production Company will be fully responsible for the actions of theirsubcontractors.

A complete copy of the approved Application for Permit to Drillwill be furnished to the
field representative(s) to ensure compliance and shall be on location during all

construction and drilling operations.

I hereby certifythat I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the
proposed drill site and access route; that I am familiar with the conditions which currently

exist; that the statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and
correct; and that the work associated withthe operations proposed herein will be

performed by Questar Exploration & Production Company it's contractors and subcontractors
in conformitywith this plan and the termsand conditions under which it is approved. This
statement is subject to the provisions of 18 U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

10-Nov-07
Jan Nelšon Date

f Red Wash



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
GD #l6G-35-9-15

LOCATED IN DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH
SECTION 35, T9S, R15E, S.L.B.&M.

PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #5 TO LOCATION STAKE CAMERA ANGLE: SOUTHEASTERLY

PHOTO: VIEW FROM BEGINNING OF PROPOSED ACCESS CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHWESTERLY

d

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying LOCATION PHOTos 09 28 07 novo
85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 [ONTil DAY YEAR

smce& 435-789-1017 uels@uelsinc.com TAKENBY:D.A. DRAWNBY.C.P.



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD. I iFICURE #i
LOCATION LAYOUT FOR

GD #16G-35-9-15
Approx.

SECTION 35, T9S, R15E, S.L.B.&M. Toe of
CONSTRUCT 515' FSL 604' FEL Eill Sl°P*
DIVERSION
DITCH .

Proa sed Access

s C- J. O
<a 6 B. 59.5'

r s' Sto. J+50

SCALE: 1" = 50' F-25'
DATE: 10-11-07 E/. 54.0, Round Corners

Drawn By S.L. as Needed

Re-Route
Existing Road

No1E. as Needed
Existing

Flore Pit is to be located Drainage
o min. of 100' from the / 4-
Well Head. /

Pit Topsoi/
PIPE TUBS

Approx.
Top of
Cut Slope PIPE RACKS

C-4.7'
E. 61.2'

RIG

B. 74. J'
C-J28

- 1
(btm. p/t) -- - -

C-9.8' F-11.5'
·¯ LIGHTPLANT

BOILER

COMPRES OR WATER
PUMP HOUSE I TANK

BOOSTER fy

Total Pit Capacity
W/2' of Freeboard TR SH
= 12,240 Ob/s. ±
Total Pit Volume

= 3,210 Cu. Yds ; i

RESER ITS

,
C- J.O'

NOTES. 66 7'

Bev. Ungraded Ground At Loc. Stake = ÛJÛ/.
; I.IINTAH ENCINEERING & LAND SURVEYING

F/N/SHED GRADE ELEV A T LOC. STAKE = 6356.5 85 So. 200 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (436)



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD· FICURE #2
. TYPICALCROSS SECTIONS FOR ' 'X--Section

scale GD #16G-35-9-15
SECTION 35, T9S, R15E, S.L.B.&M. SUR

. y1 = 50'
515' FSL 604' FEL

DATE: 10-11-07
Drawn By S.L.

Preconstruction 48' 150°
Grade

Finished Grade

STA. J+50

T 10 70' 48' 150
Location Stake

S/ope =

-

, / 1 1/2: 1

S TA. 1+ 75
10 70' 48' 150

S TA. 0+ 75
- CUT

48' 150

CUT
'

N

APPROXIMATEYARDAGES \S TA. 0+ 00 ..

CUT
(6") Topsoil Stripping = 2, 120 Cu. Yds. NOTE:

Remaining Location = 16,890 Cu. Yds. Topsoil should not be * NOTE
Stripped Below Finished F/LL QUANT/TY/NCLUDES

TOTAL CUT = 19,010 CU.YDS. Grade on Substructure Area. 5% FOR COMPACTION

FILL = 15,280 CU.YDS.
APPROX/MA7E ACREAGES

Excess Material = J,7JO Cu. Yds.
WELLS/TE O/S7URBANCE = ±2.472 ACRES

Topsoil & Pit Backfill = J,7JO Cu. Yds· ACCESS ROAD O/STURBANCE = ±0.144 ACRES
(1/2 Pit Vol.)

TOTAL = ±2.616 ACRES
EXCESS UNBALANCE = 0 Cu. Yds.

fÍINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING(After Interim Rehabilitation)
85 So. 200 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (436)



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD. FICURE #
INTERIM RECLAMATIONPLAN FOR

GD #16G-35-9-15
SECTION 35, T9S, R15E, S.L.B.&M. 'I

515' FSL 604' FEL
Access y•
Road

SCALE: 1" = 50'
DATE: 10-11-07 p J ]

Drawn By S.L.

1

WELLHEAD

Production Tonks

GAS UNIT m

INTERIMRECLAMATION
UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
86 So. ß00 East * Vernal, UtaA 84078 • (436)



M L +

2.8 MI

MI. +/-

T9S

PROPOSED LOCATION:
GD #16G-35-9-15

LEGEND: QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
O PROPOSED LOCATION N GD #16G-35-9-15

SECTION 35, T9S, R15E, S.L.B.&M.
515' FSL 604' FEL

M Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I c 09 28 0785 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 M A P MONTH DAY YEAR(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813

SCALE:1:100,000 DRAWNBY:C.P. REVISED:00-00-00
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Uintah Engineering & I,and Surveying
85 Suunth 200 E4nst Vernasi, Uinh 8407N

4435) 189-1017 * IPA% (435) 789-IN 13



WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 11/16/2007 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-013-33833

WELL NAME: GD 16G-35-9-15

OPERATOR: QUESTAR EXPLORATION & ( N5085 ) PHONE NUMBER: 435-781-4331

CONTACT: JAN NELSON

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /

SESE 35 090S 150E Tech Review Initials Date
SURFACE: 0515 FSL 0604 FEL

BOTTOM: 0515 FSL 0604 FEL Engineering

COUNTY: DUCHESNE Geology
LATITUDE: 39.98160 LONGITUDE: -110.1914

UTM SURF EASTINGS:569045 NORTHINGS: 4425819 Surface

FIELD NAME: UNDESIGNATED ( 2 )

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal

LEASE NUMBER: UTU-78021 PROPOSED FORMATION: GRRV

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal COALBED METHANE WELL? NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

v/' Plat R649-2-3.

w/ Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[]
Unit:

No. ESBOOOO24 )
Potash (Y/N) sy R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception

(No. 49-2153 )
Drilling Unit

RDCC Review (Y/N)
Board Cause No:(Date: )
Eff Date:

Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

Intent to Commingle (Y/N) ,R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:



27
ASEEY FED A5mEY FED

ARE.EY FED ASHLEY FED ASKEY FED 9 2&&l5 12 25+15
ASEEY FED ASKEY FED 10 27-9 5

927->IS • 12-2&9-15 10-26+5 *
12-27+15 11-27-9-15 e ASREY FED

MONUMENT BUTTE FIELD
ASHLEY FED
15-27-9-15

ARREY FED ASHLEY FED - FED
ASKEY FED '

ASH EY FED
16 21-9·5 e B-2&&15

y E-26 9-5 e Y FED
15-27-9-15

14-17-9-15

TSS RisE

FEDERAL GD
3 34+$5 IG 3+ 9 LE GD i

g. GD GDrgi 1G359t! 35915
IG359L5

2G (5 4G 35 9-L5

GD i
GD BG 35915
EG 35 9 15 g GD

[5 35915 7G35915

GD GD g GD GD GD 6
KKr34 9 45 OG-31 9 Lg 120 35 9 LS GD $ 10G35+15 UG 35 9 ts

HG-35-9-15

GDig GD G GD
GD

LE 4 9 5 i H+6 15G 35 9 15
GD GD 2

LIG L4 9 15 13G 35 9 15 L6G-15 9 IS

T105 R15E

GILSONITE
DRA 3 02GE

GH.10NM
DRAW 503GR

OPERATOR: QEP EXPL & PROD (N5085)
UTAH

SEC:34,35 T.9S R.15E DNR
FIELD: UNDESIGNATED (002)

COUNTY: y (gng
Wells Status

SPACING: R649-3-2 / GENERAL SITING µ GAS INJECTION
g GAS STORAGE OIL, GAS & MINING
x LOCATION ABANDONED

NEW LOCATION NField Status Unit Status PLUGGED & ABANDONED
ABANDONED

[¯¯¯]EXPLORATORY PRODUCING GAS
ACTIV E GAS STORAGE PRODUCING OIL

NF PP OIL g SHUT-IN GASCOMBINED NFSECONDARY
« SHUT-INOIL W E

tNACTIVE [ ]PENDING
)s( TEMP.ABANDONED

I TED ERML A ER
LNJECTION

S
PP OIL g WATER SUPPLY PREPARED BY:DIAN A MASON
SECONDARY WATER DISPOSAL DATE: 2 NOVEMBER-2007
TERMINATED



State w Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER

JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
Division of Oil Gas and Mining

Goternor JOHN R. BAZA
IJit ision IJirector

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Got-ernor

Novernber 20, 2007

QuestarExploration & Production Company
11002 E 17500 S
Vernal, UT 84078

Re: GD 16G-35-9-15 Well, 515' FSL, 604' FEL, SE SE, Sec. 35, T. 9 South, R. 15 East,
Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et seq., Utah
Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous
operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date. The API
identification number assigned to this well is 43-013-33833.

Sincerely,

Gil Hunt
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Duchesne County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal Office

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • wincogm.utah.goy OIL, GAS &



Operator: QuestarExploration & Production Company
Well Name & Number GD 16G-35-9-15

API Number: 43-013-33833
Lease: UTU-78021

Location: SE SE Sec.1 T. 9 South R. 15 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.

• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dustin Doucet at (801) 538-5281 office (801) 733-0983 home

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Board").
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the



FORM APPROVED

Form 3160-3 OMB NO. 1040413G

UNITED STATES SUBMITINTRIPLICATE" Expires:February28,1995

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NO.
BUREAUOF LANDMANAGEMENT UTU-78021

6. IF INDIAN,ÀLLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN NIA

TYPE OF WORK LL a L : . mt I-
7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAINIE

DRILL El DEEËEN N/A
TYPE OF WELL 8. FARMÖR LEASE NAME,WELL NO.

SÏNGLE MULTIPLE
ÖlL WELL GAS WELL OTHER ZONE ZONE GD 10G-35-9 a
2. NAMEOF OPERATÒR Contact: Jan Nelson 9.API NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLÒRATION& PRODU0TióN COMPANY E-Mail: jin.nelson@guestar.com ff ŸÊ

3. ADDRESS Telphone number 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT
11002 r. 17500 S. Vernal, Ut 84078 Phone 435-781-4331 Fax 435-781-4395 UNDESIGNATED

4. LOCATIONOF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with and $tate requirements*) 11. SEC T, R, M, OR BLK & SURVEY OR AREA
At Surface 515' FSL 604' FEL, SESE, SECTION 38, T98, RiëË
At proposed production zone SiiC. 35, TSS, R1aE Mer SLB

14. DISTANCEIN MILES FROM NEAREST TOWN ÓR POSTOFFICE* 12. COUNTYOR PARISH 13. $TATE
20 + I y SOUTHWEST OF MYTON,UTAH DUCHE$NE UT
15. DISTANCEFROINIPROPOSED LOCATIONTÖNEAREST 10.NO.OF ACRÈS INLEASE 17. NÖ.OF ACR$S ASStGNED TO THIS WËLL

PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE, FT.
(also to nearest drig,unit line If any) 960.00 40

515' + I -

18.DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED location to nearest well, driffing, 19. PROPO$ED DEPTH 20. BLMIBlABond No. on file
completed, applied for, on this lease, ft ESBOOOO24

5,000'

21. ELEVATIONS($hoW whether DF, RT, GR, ect.) 22. DATEWORK WILL$TART 23. Estimated duration
6356.5' GR ASAP 7 days .

24. Attachments

The following,completed in accordance with the requirments of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:
1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor 4. Bond to cover theoperations unless covered by an exisiting bond on file (see
2. A DrillingPlan Item 20 above).
3. A surface Use Plan ( if location is ori National Forest System Lands, 5. Operatorcertification.

the SUP0 shall be filed with the appropriateForest Service Öffice) 6. Such otimr site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the
authorized officer.

SIGNED Name (printedItyped) Jan Nelson DATE 1140-07

TITL Regulatory Affairs REC D
(This space Federal or State office use)

PÈRMIT NO. APPROVAL DATÉ
Application approval does not warrasit or certify the applicant ho da any legal or equitablå titletothose rights in the sublect lease which would entitle theappiltant to con þe t n n

CONDITIONSOF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

AssiátantFieldManager
APPRÖVEDBY TITL ( gggg gg gggy DATE

*See Instructions On Reverse Side

Title 18 ÚÃC Section 1001,makes it a critnefor any person knowingly and willfullyto make to any department or agency of the

United statesany false, fictitious or fraudulent statonientsor representations as to any mater within its jurisdiction

CONDITIONSOFAPPROVALATTACHED
NOTICEOF



UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

VERNAL FIELD OFFICE
170 South 500 East VERNAL, UT 84078 {435) 781-4400

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company Questar Exploration & Production Co. Location: SESE, Sec. 35, T9S, R15E
Well No: GD 16G-35-9-15 Lease No: UTU-78021
APl No: 43-013-33833 Agreement: NIA

Title Name Office Phone Number Cell Phone Number
Petroleum Engineer: Matt Baker (435) 781-4490 (435) 828-4470
Petroleum Engineer: Michael Lee (435) 781-4432 (435) 828-7875
Petroleum Engineer: James Ashley (435) 781-4470 (435) 828-7874
Petroleum Engineer: Ryan Angus (435) 781-4430 (435) 828-7368
Supervisory Petroleum Technician: Jamie Sparger (435) 781-4502 (435) 828-3913
NRS/Enviro Scientist; (435) 781-4475 (435) 828-4029
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Karl Wright (435) 781-4484 (435) 828-7381
NRS/Enviro Scientist: HollyVilla (435) 781-4404
NRS/Enviro Scientist: (435) 781-4476
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Chuck Macdonald (435) 781-4441 (435) 828-7481
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Jannice Cutler (435) 781-3400 (435) 828-3544
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Michael Cutler (435) 781-3401 (435) 828-3546
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Anna I¯igueroa (435) 781-3407 (435) 828-3548
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Verlyn Pindell (435) 781-3402 (435) 828-3547
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Darren Williams (435) 781-4447
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Nathan Packer (435) 781-3405 (435) 828-3545

Fax: (435) 781-3420

A COPY OF THESE CONDITIONS SHALL BE FURNISHED TO YOUR
FIELD REPRESENTATIVE TO INSURE COMPLIANCE

All lease and/or unit operations are to be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made with the
applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR Part 3160), and this approved Application for Permit to Drill including
Surface and Downhole Conditions of Approval. The operator is considered fully responsible for the actions of his
subcontractors. A copy of the approved APD must be on location during construction, drilling, and completiori
o¢erations. This permit is approved for a two (2) year period, or until lease expiration, whichever occurs
first. An additional extension, up to two (2) years, may be applied for by sundry notice prior to expiration.

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Location Construction - Forty-Eight (48) hours prior to constructionof location and
(Notify Environmental Scientist) access roads.
Location Completion - Prior to moving on the drilling rig.
(Notify Environmental Scientist)
Spud Notice - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.
(Notify Petroleum Engineer)
Casing String & Cementing - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to running casing and
(Notify Supv. Petroleum Tech.) cementing all casing strings.
BOP & Related Equipment Tests - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests
(Notify Supv. Petroleum Tech.)
First Production Notice - Within Five (5) business days after new well begins or
(Notify Petroleum Engineer) production resumes after well has been off production for

more than ninety (90)
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SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONSOF APPROVAL (COAs)

• Ifthere is an active Gilsonite mining operation within2 miles ofthe well location, operator shall
notify the Gilsonite operator at least 48 hours prior to any blasting during construction.

• If paleontological materials are uncovered during construction, the operator is to imrnediately
stop work and contact the Authorized Officer (AO). A determination will be made by the AO as
to what mitigation may be necessary for the discovered paleontologic material before
construction can continue.

• Conditions for Approval are in the APD or
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DOWNHOLE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

SITE SPECIFIC DOWNHOLE COAs:

• None.

AII provisions outlined in Onshore Oil & Gas Order #2 Drilling Operations shall be strictly
adhered to. The following items are emphasized:

DRILLINGICOMPLETIONIPRODUCING OPERATING STANDARDS

• The spud date and timeshall be reported orallyto Vernal Field Office within 24 hours of
spudding.

• Notify Vernal Field Office Supervisory Petroleum Enqineering Technician at least 24 hours in
advance of casinq cementing operations and BOPE & casinq pressure tests.

• Blowout prevention equipment (BOPE) shall remain in use untilthe well is completed or
abandoned. Closing unit controls shall remain unobstructed and readily accessible at all times.
Choke manifolds shall be located outside of the rig substructure.

• All BOPE components shall be inspected daily and those inspections shall be recorded in the
daily drilling report. Components shall be operated and tested as required by Onshore Oil&
Gas Order No. 2 to insure good mechanical working order. All BOPE pressure tests shall be
performed by a test pump with a chart recorder and _NO_T_by the rig pumps. Test shall be
reported in the driller's log.

• BOP drills shall be initially conducted by each drilling crew within 24 hours of drilling out from
under the surface casing and weekly thereafteras specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 2.

• Casing pressure tests are required before drilling out from under all casing strings set and
cemented in place.

• No aggressivelfresh hard-banded drill pipe shall be used withincasing.

• Cement baskets shall not be run on surface casing.

• The operator must report all shows of water or water-bearing sands to the BLM. Ifflowing water
is encountered it must be sampled, analyzed, and a copy of the analyses submitted to the BLM
Vernal Field Office.

• The operator must report encounters of all non oil & gas mineral resources (such as Gilsonite,
tar sands, oilshale, trona,etc.) to the Vernal Field Office, in writing, within 5 working days of
each encounter. Each report shall include the well namelnumber, well location, date and depth
(from KB or GL) of encounter, vertical footage of the encounter and, the name of the person
making the report (along with a telephone number) should the BLM need to obtain additional
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• A complete set of angular deviation and directional surveys of a directional well will be
submitted to the Vernal BLMoffice engineer within 30 days of the completion of the well.

• While activelydrilling, chronologic drilling progress reports shall be filed directly with the BLM,
Vernal Field Office on a weekly basis in sundry, letter format or e-mail to the Petroleum
Engineers untilthe well is completed.

• A cement bond log (CBL) will be run from the production casing shoe to the top of cement and
shall be utilizedto determine the bond quality for the production casing. Submit a field copy of
the CBL to this office.

• Please submit an electronic copy of all other logs run on this well in LAS forinat to
UT_VN_Welllogs@BLM.gov. This submission will supersede the requirement for
submittal of paper logs to the BLM.

• There shall be no deviation from the proposed drilling, completion, and/or workover program as
approved. Safe drilling and operating practices rnust be observed. Any changes irtoperation
must have priorapproval from the BLMVernal Field
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OPERATING REQUIREMENT REMINDERS:

• Allwells, whether drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned, shall be identified in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.6. There shall be a sign or marker with the name of the operator,
lease serial number, well number, and surveyed description of the well.

• In accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-3, thiswell shall be reported on the "Monthly Report of
Operations" (Oil and Gas Operations Report ((OGOR)) starting with the month in which
operations commence and continue each month until the well is physically plugged and
abandoned. This report shall be filed in duplicate, directly with the Minerals Management
Service, P.O. Box 17110, Denver, Colorado 80217-0110, or call 1-800-525-7922 (303) 231-
3650 for reporting information.

• Should the well be successfully completed for production, the BLMVernal Field office must be
notifiedwhen it is placed in a producing status. Such notificationwill be by written
communication and must be received in this officeby not later than the fifth business day
following the date on which the well is placed on production. The notificationshall provide, as a
minimum,the following informational items:

o Operator name, address, and telephonenumber.

o Well name and number.

o Well location (¼¼,Sec., Twn, Rng, and P.M.).

o Date well was placed in a producing status (date of first production for which royaltywill
be paid).

o The nature of the well's production, (i.e., crude oil,or crude oil and casing head gas, or
natural gas and entrained liquid hydrocarbons).

o The Federal or Indian lease prefix and number on which the well is located; otherwise
the non-Federal or non-Indian land category, i.e., State or private.

o Unit agreement and/or participating area name and number, if applicable.

o Communitizationagreement number, if applicable.

• Any venting or flaring of gas shall be done in accordance with Notice to Lessees (NTL) 4A and
needs prior approval from the BLMVernal Field Office.

• All undesirable events (fires, accidents, blowouts, spills, discharges) as specified in NTL 3A will
be reported to the BLM,Vernal Field Office. Major events, as defined in NTL3A, shall be
reported verbally within 24 hours, followed by a written report within 15 days. "Other than Major
Events" will be reported in writing within 15 days. "Minor Events" will be reported on the
Monthly Report of Operations and Production.

• Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well Completion and
Recompletion Report and Log" (BLM Form 3160-4) shall be submitted not later than 30 days
after completion of the well or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.4-1. Two copies of all logs run, core descriptions, and all other surveys
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data obtained and compiled during the drilling,workover, and/or completion operations, shall be
filed on BLM Form 3160-4 Subbit with the well completion report a geologic report including,
at a minimum,formation tops, and a summary and conclusions. Also include deviation surveys,
sample descriptions, strip logs, core data, drillstem test data, and results of production tests if
performed. Samples (cuttings, fluid,and/or gas) shall be submitted only when requested by the
BLM,Vernal Field Office.

• Alloff-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or comminglingon-lease or off-lease, shall have
prior written approval from the BLMVernal Field Office.

• Oiland gas meters shall be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries The BLMVernal Field
Office Petroleum Engineers willbe provided with a date and timefor the initial meter calibration
and all future meter proving schedules. A copy ofÏhemeter calibration reports shall be
submitted to the BLMVernal Field Office. All measurement facilities willconform to the API
standards for liquid hydrocarbons and the AGA standards for natural gas measurement. All
measurement points shall be identified as the point of sale or allocation for royaltypurposes.

• A schematic facilities diagram as required by Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be subrnitted
to the BLMVernal Field Office within30 days of installation or first production, whichever occurs
first All site security regulations as specified in Onshore OiP&Gas Order No. 3 shallbe
adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks willbe effectively
sealed in accordance with Onshore Oil& Gas Order No. 3.

• Any additional construction, reconstruction, or alterations of facilities, including roads, gathering
lines, batteries, etc., which will result in the disturbance of new ground, shall require the filing of
a suitable plan and need prior approval of the BLMVernal Eield Office. Emergency approval
may be obtained orally, but such approval does not waive the written report requirement.

• No location shall be constructed or moved, no well shall be plugged, and no drilling or workover
equipment shall be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without prior
approval of the BLMVernal Field Office. If operationsare to be suspended for more than 30
days, prior approval of the BLMVernal Field Office shall be obtained and notification.given
before resumption of operations.

• Pursuant to Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 7, this is authorization for pit disposal of water
produced from thiswell for a period of 90 days from the date of initial production. A permanent
disposal method must be approved by this office and in operation prior to the end of this 90-day
period. In order to meet this deadline, an application for the proposed permanent disposal
method shall be submitted along with any necessary water analyses, as soon as possible, but
no later than 45 days after the date of first production. Any method of disposal which has not
been approved prior to the end of the authorized90-day period will be considered as an Incident
of Noncompliance and will be grounds for issuing a shut-in order until an acceptable manner for
disposing of said water is provided and approved by this office.

• Unless the plugging is to take place immediately upon receipt of oral approval, the Field Office
Petroleum Engineers must be notifiedat least 24 hours in advance of the plugging of the well, in
order that a representative may witness pluggingoperations. Ifa well is suspended or
abandoned, all pits must be fenced immediately untilthey are backfilled The "Subsequent
Report of Abandonment" (Form BLM3160-5) must be submitted within 30 days after the actual
plugging of the well bore, showing location of plugs, amount of cement in each, and amount of
casing left in hole, and the current status of the surface
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DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: QuestarExploration & Production Co.

Well Name: Gp 16G-35-9-15

API No: 43-013-33833 Lease Type: Federal

Section 35 Township 09S Range 15E County Duchesne

Drilling Contractor Pete Martin Rig # Rathole

SPUDDED:
Date 6-13-08

Time

How Dry

Drilling wi/I Commence:

Reported by Rick Bush

Telephone # 307-850-2092

Date 6-13-08 Signed



State of Utah OPERATOR ACCT. No. N-5085
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining OPERATOR: Questar Exploration & Production Co.

ADDRESS: 11002 East 17500 South
ENTlTY ACTION FORM - FORM 6 Vernal, Utah 84078 (435)781-4342

Action Current New Entity API Number Well Name QQ SC TP RG County Spud Date Effective Date
Code Entity No.

No.
99999 43-013-33833 GD 16G 35 9 15 SESE 35 9S 15 Uintah 8/14/2008 '

WELL 1 COMMENTS:ww CONFIOUlãl.s

WELL 2 COMMENTS:

WELL 3 COMMENTS:

WELL 4 COMMENTS:

WELL 5 COMMENTS:

ACTION CODES (See instructions on back of form)
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only)
B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unit well)
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity Signature
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity
E - Other (explain in comments section) Office Administrator II 6/16/08

Title Date
NOTE: Use COMMENT section to explain why each Action Code was selected

Phone No. (435)781-4342
(3/89)



Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
quae imo) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 10044)l35

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Epket Much31 IW3

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-78021
Do not use this formfor proposals to drill or to deepenor reentry to a differentreservoir

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals 5. IfIndian,AllotteeorTribeName

N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICA TE I KUna or CA, Agreement Designation
1. TypeofWeH N/A

Oil Gas

Well Wen Other 8. Well Name and No.

GD 16G 35 9 15
2 NameofOperator

QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. 9. API Weu No.

Address and Telephone No. Contact: Dahn.Caldwell@questar.com 43-013-33833
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH - VERNAL, UT 84078 435-781-4342 Fax 435-781-4357 10 Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4 Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M, or Survey Description) UNDESIGNATED

515' FSL, 604' FEL, SESE, SEC 35-T9S-R15E 11. CountyorParish,State

UINTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE B 3X(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, 3R OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans

O -- O New Construction

Subsequent Report O "- O Non-Routine Fracturing

CasingRepä WaterShut-Off

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Comio to œ

other SPUD Dispose Water

(Note) Report results ofmultiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, andgive pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true verlical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)

On 6/14/08 - Drilled 40' of 20" conductor hole. Set 40' of 14" conductor pipe. Cmtd w/ Ready Mix.

RECEIVED
JUN19 2008

3 - BLM, 2- Utah OG&M, - Denver, 1- file Wr file-server
OFOIL,GAS&MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing i tme anda:o
Signed Dahn Caldwell ( , Office Administator II Date 6AGO8

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Approved by: Title Date

Conditions of approvat if any se

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency ofthe United States an laÌ¾,fic¾oui s or
representations as to any matter within its



UTAH DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

NOTICE OF REPORTING PROBLEMS

Operator: Questar Exploration & Production Co Account: 5085 Today's Dat 10/23 2008

Problems: .Failure to submit reports in a timely,accurate, and

O complete manner may result in the issuance of a Notice of/ Late Report(s) Violation by the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, and may
result in the Division pursuing enforcement action asInaccurate Report(s) outlined in Rule R649-10, Administrative Procedures, and

Incomplete Report(s) Section 40-6-11 of the Utah Code.

O Other. To avoid compliance action, these reporting problems
should be resolved within 7 days.

Send reports to: Fax to:

Utah Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining (801) 359-3940 'XL
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210 jg
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Type of Report Month(s) of Problem Report

O Production - Form 10

O Disposition - Form 11

O Gas Plant - Form 13

Enhanced Recovery - UIC Form 2

Injection - UIC Form 3

Other

Type of Report Well Name(s) API Number(s) Drilling Commenced

Spud Notice - Form 9

Drilling Reports - Form 9

Well Completion Report - Form 8

Other List Attached

Description of Problem:

Per R649-3-6 2.4 The operator shall submit a rnonthly status report for each drillingwell on Form 9, Sundry Notice and
Reports on Wells. The report should include the well depth and a description of the operations conducted on the well
during the month.

If you have questions or concerns regarding this matter, please contact Rachel Medina at (801) 538-5260
.

cc: Compliance File
RAM
Well File



UTAH DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

NOTICE OF REPORTING PROBLEMS

ATTACHMENT

Operator: Questar Exploration & Production Co Account: N5085 Today's Date: 10/23/2008

Well Names API Numbers Drilling Commenced

RWS 8D-5-9-24 4304737307 01/11/2008

RW 04-25B 4304736982 02/05/2008

SCS 5C-32-14-19 4304738963 03/17/2008

FR 4P-21-14-20 4304739811 03/30/2008

WV 7BD-23-8-21 4304739044 04/12/2008

GB 15D-27-8-21 4304739662 04/26/2008

Brennan 1 4304715417 05/28/2008

WRU GB 13G-3-8-22 4304739792 06/08/2008

GD 1G-34-9-15 4301333827 06/13/2008

GD 16G-35-9-15 4301333833



QUESTAR Page 1 of 2

Operations Summary Repo

Legal Well Name: GD 16G-35-9-15
Common Well Name: GD 16G-35-9-15 Spud Date: 6/14/2008
Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 11/12/2008 End: 11/19/2008
Contractor Name: Ensign DrillingUSD Rig Release: 11/1/2008 Group:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 57

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Phase Description of Operations

11/13/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 TRP 2 COMPLETION
On 11/12/08 @7:00 AM - Change over to tbg equipment. RU rig floor.
Wait on tbg to be delivered. At 3:30 PM, spot tbg trailer. PU, tally&
rabbit in hole with 5-1/2" csg scraper & 173 jts 2-7/8" tbg. Tag PBTD @
5650'. Roll hole wl 150 bbis 2% KCL. SDFN @7:00 PM.

24 Hour Forecast: POOH w/ tbg & scraper. Run CBL & perf.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5#
Csg Depth: 5697'

11/15/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 TRP 2 COMPLETION
On 11/14/08 @7:00 AM - POOH w/ tbg &scraper. RU Lone Wolf
wireline, run CBL from 5650' to surface. Good cmt to fluid level @450'.
Perforate Uteland Butte formation fl 5496' - 5503'. RD WL. RIH w/
5-1/2" pkr & 167 jts 2-7/8" workstring. Set pkr @5457', test to 1000#,
good test. RU swab equipment. Swab tbg dry in 5 runs, recovered 30
bbis water w/ no oil or gas. SDFN @5:00 PM.

24 Hour Forecast: Acidize.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5#
Csg Depth: 5697'

11/18/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 1 COMPLETION
On 11/17/08 @7:00 AM - 0 psi on well. RIH w/ swab, tbg dry, no fluid
entry over weekend. RU Superior acid crew, filltbg with 30 bbis 2%
KCL water. Establish injection rate of 4-1/2 BPM &2500 psi, pump
6000 gais 15% HCL alternating gelled &regular acid stages. Displace
acid w/ 30 bbis 2% KCL. ISIP = 2200 psi, 15 minute SIP = 1950 psi.
RD acid crew, open well to flat tank, flowback 36 bbis water &acid. Tbg
died. RU swab & recovered 80 bbis fluid, final oil cut 30% w/ a lot of
gas. SDFN @5:00 PM.

24 Hour Forecast: Continue to swab.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5#
Csg Depth: 5697'

11/19/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 COMPLETION
On 11/18/08 @7:00 AM w/ 450 psi SITP. Open well to pit, bled down in
5 minutes. RIH w/ swab. IFL@2000'. Made 8 swab runs. Recovered
60 bbis oil & 10 bbis water, swabbing 90 to 100% oil on last 6 runs. Tbg
blowing gas for 15 minutes after each run. FFL @4000'. Estimated
fluid entry rate of 6 BPH. RD swab equipment, release pkr. POOH w/
60 stands tbg leaving 23 stands in hole as killstring. SDFN @5:00 PM.

24 Hour Forecast: POOH. Lay down pkr. RIH w/ production tbg.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5#
Csg Depth: 5697'

11/20/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 BOP 1 COMPLETION
On 11/19/08 @7:00 AMOpsi SITP, POOH wl killstring &5-1/2" pkr.
RIH wl production tbg. RD rig floor, ND BOP;s. Set 5-1/2" B-2 TAC,
land tbg on B-1 flange w/ 14000# tension. NU WH &flow lines, change
over to rod equipment. Flush tbg wl 70 bbls chemical water, well circ

Printed: 12/1/2008 10:28:42
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: GD 16G-35-9-15
Common Well Name: GD 16G-35-9-15 Spud Date: 6/14/2008
Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 11/12/2008 End: 11/19/2008
Contractor Name: Ensign DrillingUSD Rig Release: 11/1/2008 Group:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 57

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Phase Description of Operations

11/20/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 BOP 1 last 10 bbis. PU &bucket test new pump - OK. RIH w/ rods and pump,
seat and space out, filltbg w/ 2 bbis water. Long stroke pump fl 200 to
800 psi in 4 strokes, good test, good test, good pump action. Clamp
rods off to wellhead, secure well. SDFN @5:30 PM.

FINAL REPORT

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5#
Csg Depth: 5697'

Tbg Detail:
KB 16.00
Stretch 1.50
167 Jts 2-7/8" Tbg 5454.22
5-1/2" B-2 TAC (Nabors) 2.73
PSN 1.10
1 Jt 2-7/8" Tbg 33.09
Tbg Tail @ 5508.64

Rod Detail:
1 1/2" x 26' Polish Rod
2 - 8', 1 - 4', 1 - 2' x 7/8" Ponys
86 - 7/8" Slick
130 - 3/4" Slick

Pump: Weatherford
2 1/2" x 1 1/2" x 20 x 23 x 25'
RHAC #2377 255' Max Stroke

Printed: 12/1/2008 10:28:42
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: GD 16G-35-9-15
Common Well Name: GD 16G-35-9-15 Spud Date: 6/14/2008
Event Name: COMPLETiON Start: 11/12/2008 End: 11/19/2008
Contractor Name: linsign DrillingUSD Rig Release: 11/1/2008 Group:
Rig Name: !!NSIGN Rig Number: 57

Date From - To Hours Code Phase Description of Operations

11/20/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 BOP 1 last 10 bbis. PU &bucket test new pump - OK. RIH w/ rods and pump,
seat and space out, filltbg wl 2 bbis water. Long stroke pump f/200 to
800 psi in 4 strokes, good test, good test, good pump action. Clamp
rods off to wellhead, secure well. SDFN @5:30 PM.

FINALREPORT

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5#
Csg Depth: 5697'

Tbg Detail:
KB 16.00
Stretch 1.50
167 Jts 2-7/8" Tbg 5454.22
5-1/2" B-2 TAC (Nabors) 2.73
PSN 1.10
1 Jt 2-7/8" Tbg 33.09
Tbg Tail @ 5508.64

Rod Detail:
1 1/2" x 26' Polish Rod
2 - 8', 1 - 4', 1 - 2' x 7/8" Ponys
86 - 7/8" Slick
130 - 3/4" Slick

Pump: Weatherford
2 1/2" x 1 1/2" x 20 x 23 x 25'
RHAC #2377 255' Max Stroke

12/5/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 LOC 4 COMPLETION
On 12/3/08 - Road rig from Flatrock to location.
On 12/4/08 - MIRUBasin Well Service #1. SICP = 0# & SITP = 10#.
Hot oller pumped 60 bbls 2% KCLdown csg. Unseated pump. Flushed
rods with 40 bbis 2% KCL@250 degrees. POOH w/ rods & pump.
Flushed rods when needed. NDwellhead assembly. Released tbgA.C.
set @5474'. NU BOP's. RU tbg equipment. Tally & RIHw/ 6 jts 2-7/8"
tbg. Tag PBTD @5640'. POOH w16 jts. Tbg tail @5503'. SWIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: WillPOOH wl tbg & reperforate.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5#
Csg Depth: 5697'

Perfs:
5496' - 5503'

12/8/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 PERF 2 COMPLETION - TIGHT HOLE
On 12/5/08 SICP = 0# &SITP = 0#. POOH wl production string as
follows: 167 jts tbg, TAC, PSN, 1 jt tbg w/ NC. RD tbg equipment. ND
BOP's. NU double frac valve assembly. RU J-W WL Services.
Perforate per CBIdated 11/14/08 the following intervals using a 4" gun
w/ 4 jpf&90* phasing: 5590-93'; 5490-92'; 5416-24' (52 holes) &

RECEIVE13 existing perfs @5496-5503'. Seen 0 pressure increase after
perforating. SWIFWE.

JANO62005
Printed: 1/5/2009 9:49:47 AM

DIV.0F0lL,GAS&
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: GD 16G-35-9-15
Common Well Name: GD 16G-35-9-15 Spud Date: 6/14/2008
Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 11/12/2008 End: 11/19/2008
Contractor Name: \Ënsign Drilling USD Rig Release: 11/1/2008 Group:
Rig Name: liNSIGN Rig Number: 57

SubDate From - To Hours Code Code Phase Description of Operations

12/8/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 PERF 2 24 Hour Forecast: Willfrac well.

LLTR: 150 bbis

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5#
Csg Depth: 5697'

Perfs:
5496' - 5503' (reperf)
5590 - 5593'
5490 - 5492'
5416 - 5424'

12/9/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 3 COMPLETION - TIGHT HOLE

On 12/8/08 SICP = 0#. MIRU Halliburton frac crew &JW Wireline and
frac gross perforated Green River interval 5416'- 5593' down 5-1/2" csg
using a Delta 140 2% KCLx-linked gel water system (16# gel) as
follows: Breakdown @2060#and frac with 800 gals of 15% HCL
followed by a 4500 pad and stage 1-6 ppg 20/40 mesh sand in 13000
gals of fluid followed by 1000 gals of 6 ppg 16/30 sand and flush with
800 gals of 15% HCL and 4635 gals of slick water. Total of 592 bbis of
fluid and a total of 51100# of 20/40 sand and 6000# of 16/30 sand. Max
rate = 34.2 BPM; avg rate = 28.3 BPM; max psi = 3732#; avg psi =

2508#; ISIP = 2674# (.92).Lubricate in a 5-1/2" CBP and set at 5350'.
Zone #2: Perforate Green River interval 4926' - 4934' &5056'- 5070'
(88 holes) per the CBL log dated 11/14/08 at 4 JPF and 90* phasing
using a 4" csg gun. Frac gross perforated interval 4926' - 5070' down
5-1/2" csg using the above system as follows: Break @2425#and
pump a 3500 gal pad and stage 1-6 ppg 20/40 mesh sand in 12000 gals
of fluid and followed by 6 ppg 16/30 sand in 1000 gals of fluid and flush
with 800 gals of 15% HCL and 4083 gals of slick water. Total of 491
bbis and a total of 38000#of 20/40 sand and 6800#of 16/30 sand. Max
rate = 29.8 BPM; avg rate = 27.9 BPM; max psi = 2452#; avg psi =

2210#; ISIP = 2229# (.88).Lubricate in a 5-1/2" CBP and set at 4780'.
Zone #3: Perforate Green River interval 4598' - 4604' &4736' - 4742'
per the above gun and log at 4 JPF (48 holes). Frac gross perforated
interval 4598' - 4742' down csg using the above system as follows:
Broke @1800# and pump a 4500 gal pad and stage 1-6 ppg 20/40
mesh sand in 13500 gals of fluid followed by a 500 gal stage of 6 ppg
16/30 sand and flush with 4556 gals of slick water. Total of 536 bbis of
fluidand a totalof 51130# of 20/40 sand and a totalof 2200# of 16/30
mesh sand. Max rate = 28.2 BPM; avg rate = 27.6 BPM; max psi =

2725#; avg psi = 2448#; ISIP = 2167#(.90).
Si the well and RDMO Halliburton &JW Wlreline.

24 Hour Forecast: Wi\\start c\ean out of well.

LLTR: 1750 bbis

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5# J-55
Csg Depth: 568T

Perfs:

Printed: 1/5/2009 9:49:47
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: GD 16G-35-9-15
Common Well Name: GD 16G-35-9-15 Spud Date: 6/14/2008
Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 11/12/2008 End: 11/19/2008
Contractor Name: linsign Drilling USD Rig Release: 11/1/2008 Group:
Rig Name: liNSIGN Rig Number: 57

Date From - To Hours Code C Phase Description of Operations

12/9/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STlM 3 Zone #1- Green River
5416-24'; 5490-92'; 5496-5503';
5590-5603' (80 holes)
Zone #2 - Green River
4926-34'; 5056-70' (88 holes)

59n8e-
04

4e7e3n6
2 48 holes)

12/10/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 DRL 5 COMPLETION - TIGHT HOLE

On AM of 12/9/08 SICP = 300#. Open csg &flowed back 80 bbis of
water, well died. RIHwl 4-3/4" bit &tbg. Tag sand @4715' & circ out
sand to complete plug @4780' &drillout plug. Continue in the hole &
tag sand @5315' &circ out sand to comp plug @5350' &drillout plug.
Drilledout w/ 2% KCL water and had full returns with no oil or gas.
Continue in the hole &tag sand fill@5607' wl bottom perf @5593'.
Circ hole clean @560T &pull bit to 5550' &SIFN. On 12/10/08 NOTE:
After well died thisAM, nippled down frac head assembly & NU BOP's.
SITP &SICP = 0#. Willclean out to PBTD.

24 Hour Forecast: Willclean out to PBTD of approx 5650' & POOH w/
bit & start to run production tubulars.

LLTR: 1670 bbis

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5#
Csg Depth: 5697'

Perfs:
Zone #1 -Green River
5496' - 5503' (reperf)
5496' - 5503'
5490 - 5492'
5416' - 5424'
Zone #2 - Green River
5056' - 5070'
4926' - 4934'
Zone #3 - Green River
4736' - 4742'
4598' - 4604'

12/11/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 TRP 2 COMPLETION - TIGHT HOLE

On 12/10/08 SICP = 0#. RIH &tag fillat 5607' and attempt to establish
circ and tbg is plugged. POOH w/ bit &tbg with an obstruction in the
middle of the jointabove the bit. Could not know out. RIHwl production
tbg &anchor. Tag @5607' and circ out sand to 5611' and very hard.
Pull tbg tailto 5468' &SN at 5434' and anchor @5432'. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Willset anchor and ND BOP's & NUWH &run rods
& pump &return well to production.

Printed: 1/5/2009 9:49:47
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: GD 16G-35-9-15
Common Well Name: GD 16G-35-9-15 Spud Date: 6/14/2008
Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 11/12/2008 End: 11/19/2008
Contractor Name: linsign DrillingUSD Rig Release: 11/1/2008 Group:
Rig Name: IENSIGN Rig Number: 57

Date From - To Hours Code C Phase Description of Operations
i
12/11/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 TRP 2

NEW PBTD = 5611' (as of 12/10/08)

LLTR: 1670 bbis

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5#
Csg Depth: 5697'

Perfs:
Zone #1 -Green River
5496' - 5503' (reperf)
5496' - 5503'
5490 - 5492'
5416' - 5424'
Zone #2 - Green River
5056' - 5070'
4926' - 4934'
Zone #3 - Green River
4736' - 4742'
4598' - 4604'

12/12/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 TRP 18 COMPLETION - TIGHT HOLE

On 12/11/08 SITP &SICP = 0#. Bucket test new pump. RIH wl new
pump. RIHw/ new pump: 130 - 3/4" plain rods; 87 - 7/8" plain rods &
1-1/2" x 22' polish rod. Seat pump and long stroke to 500# and held
OK. Hang off well and turnover to production department. On AMof
12/12/08 well is pumping OK. Will RDMO Basin Well Service #1 this
AM.

FINALREPORT

NEW PBTD = 5611' (as of 12/10/08)

LLTR: 1670 bbis

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5#
Csg Depth: 5697'

Perfs:
Zone #1 -Green River
5496' - 5503' (reperf)
5496' - 5503'
5490 - 5492'
5416' - 5424'
Zone #2 - Green River
5056' - 5070'
4926' - 4934'
Zone #3 - Green River
4736' - 4742'
4598' - 4604'

Printed: 1/5/2009 9:49:47
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: GD 16G-35-9-15
Common Well Name: GD 16G-35-9-15 Spud Date: 6/14/2008
Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 11/12/2008 End: 11/19/2008
Contractor Name: linsign DrillingUSD Rig Release: 11/1/2008 Group:
Rig Name: IENSIGN Rig Number: 57

SubDate From - To Hours Code Code Phase Description of Operations

12/12/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 TRP 18
Tbg Detail
NC 0.44
1 Jt 2-718"Tbg 32.53
AC wl 15M# tension 1.89
167 Jts of 2-7/8" Tbg 5423.56
KB 16
Tbg Tail @ 5475.50

AC @ 5441.45
AIIDepths are KB depths
AIItbg is 2-7/8" EUE 8rd 6.5# J-55

Rod Detail:
130 3/4" Plain Rods
87 - 7/8" Plain Rods
No Ponies
1-1/2"x22' Polish Rod

Pump Detail:
2-1/2"x1-1/2"x20x23x25 RHAC (#2340wl max stroke of 227')

Printed: 1/5/2009 9:49:47



Form 3160-4
(August 2007)

UNITED STATES
FORM APPROVEDDEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: July 31, 2010

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG 5. LeaseSerialNo.
UT-78021

la Type of Well Oil Well Gas Well Dry U Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
b. Type of Completion: New Well U Work Over LJ Deepen O Plug Back DifE Resvr., N/A

Other: 7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.
N/A

2. Name of Operator 8. Lease Name and Well No.
Questar Exploration & Production Co- GD 16G 35 9 15
3. Address 11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH - VERNAL, UT 84078 3a. Phone No. (include area code) 9. AFI Well No.

435.781.4342 - Dahn Caldwell 43-013-33833
4. Location of Welt (Report location clear/v and in accordance >rith Federal requirements)* I0. Field and Pool or Exploratory

515'FSL, 604' FEL, SESE, SEC 35-T9S-R15E UNDESIGNATED
At surface I1. Sec., T., R., M., on Block and

Survey or Area SEC 35-T98-R15E

515' FSL, 604' FEL, SESE, SEC 35-T9S-Ri5E
At top prod. interval reported below 12. County or Parish 13. State

At total depth 515' FSL, 604' FEL, SESE, SEC 35-T9S-R15E DUCHESNE UT
14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16. Date Completed 11/25/2008 17. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)*
06/14/2008 10/30/2008 QD & A g Ready to Prod 6377' KB
18 Total Depth: MD 5697' 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 561 Yas of 12/10/08 20 Depth Bridge Plug Set: MD

TVD TVD TVD
2 Type Electric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy ofeach) 22. Was well cored? ONo Yes (Submit analysis)

' BL Was DST run? O No Yes (Submit report)
Directional Survey? No Yes (Subnut copyi

23. Casing nd Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)

Hole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#/ft) Top (MD) Bottom (MD) StageDCementer No of SCks& Slu 1 Cement Top* Amount Pulled

12-1/4" 9-5/8"J-55 36# 461' 225 SXS SURF - CIRC
7-7/8" 5-1/2" J-55 15.5# 5697' 660 SXS 2,998' - LOG

24. Tubing tecord
Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD)

2-7/8" 5476'
25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record

Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status
A) GREEN RIVER 5416' 5593' 5416' - 5593' 52 OPEN

GREEN RIVER 4926' 5070' 4926' - 5070' 88 OPEN
C) GREEN RIVER 4598' 4742' 4598'-4742' 48 OPEN
D)

27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, etc.
Depth Interval Amount and Type of Material

GREEN RIVER 5496'-5503' ACIDIZE W/ 6,000 GALS OF 15% HCL
GREEN RIVER 5416'-5593' FRAC Wl57,100# SAND IN 24,864 GALS
GREEN RIVER4926' - 5070' FRAC W/ 44,800# SAND IN 20,622 GALS
GREEN RIVER4598' - 4742' FRAC W/ 53,330# SAND IN 22,512 GALS
28. Production - Interval A
Date First Test Date Hours fest 3il 3as Water Gil Gravity 3as ProductionMethod
Produced Tested Production 3BL MCF BBL Corr API 3ravity PUMPING
11/25/08 12/22/08 24 67 0 70

Choke Tbg. Press. Osg. 24 Hr Dil 3as Water 3as/Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Kate BBL MCF GBL Ratio PRODUCING

N/A
840#

10#
28a. Production - Interval B a e-
Date First Test Date Hours fest 3il 3as Water 3il Gravity 3as Production Method i VC 2)
Produced Tested Production àBL MCF BBL Corr.API 3ravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Osg. 24 Hr. 3il Gas Water 3as/Oil Well Status
Size wg. Press. Aate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

*(See instructions and spaces for additional data on page



28b. Production - Interval C
Date First Test Date Hours fest 3il Gas Water Dil Gravity 3as roduction Method
l&duced Tested roduction SBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. psg. 24Hr. Úil 3as Water Sas/Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate 3BL MCF SBL Ratio

SI

28c. Production - Intervat D
Date First Test Date Hours fest 3il Gas Water 3il Gravity 3as Production Method
Produced Tested Uroduction BBL MCP BBL orr.API 3ravity

Choke Tbg. Press "sg. 4 Hr 3il 3as Water 3as/Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. ress. ate 3BL MCF 3DL Ratio

SI

29. Disposition of Gas (Solid, usedfor fuel vented, etc.)
SOLD

30. Summaryof Porous Zones (Include Aquifors): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contentsthereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stemtests,
includingdepth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures and
recoveries.

Top
Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents,etc. Name

Meas. Depth

GREEN RIVER UNCERTAIN GARDEN GULCHMbr4128'
UTELAND BUTTE Mbr-6430' Per Geologist

32 Additional remark; (include p ugging proced are):

RECEiVED
DEC29 262

DIEOFOIL,GAS&MNNO
33. Indicate which items have been attached by placing a check in the appropriateboxes:

DElectrical/MechanicalLogs(1fullsetreq'd.) ÛGeologicReport DDSTReport Directional Survey

O Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification DCore Analysis COther:

34. I hereby certify that the foregoingand attachedinformationis complete andcorrect as determinedfrom all available records (see attached instructions)*

ame (please pr di Title COMPLETION SUPERVISOR

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any personknowinglyand willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the UnitedStates any
false, fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction- a a e a una se a www a s

(Continuedon page 3) (Form 3160-4. page



Questar E & P Page 1 of3

Operations Summary Report - De i A

Well Name: GD 16G-35-9-15 Spud Date: 6/14/2008
Location: 35- 9-S 15-E 26 Rig Release: 11/1/2008
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 57

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

9112/2008 06:00 - 10:30 4,50 LOC 2 SPUD CONDUCTOR ON 6/14/2008 AT 10:00 HRS.
DRILL20" HOLE 40' DEEP AND RUN 14" CASING. CEMENT WITH READYMIX.

10:30 - 15:30 5.00 DRL 9 DRILL12 1/4"HOLE TO 490'. BLOW DOWN WELL.
15:30 -17:00 1.50 TRP 3 LAYDOWN DRILLSTRING.
17:00 - 18:30 1.50 CSG 2 RUN 12 JOINTS OF 9 5/8", 36#, J-55, LT&C CASING AS FOLLOWS: SHOE AT

46f, FLOAT COLLAR AT 420.09'. RAN 3 CENTRAUZERS FROM 45f TO 382'
AND ON AT 73'.
MOTE: ALLMEASURMENTS ARE FROM GROUND LEVEL.

18:30 -19:30 1.00 CMT 2 CEMENT AS FOLLOWS: PUMP 50 BBL OF FRESH WATER, PUMP 20 BBL OF
GEL SPACER. LEAD 15.8 PPG, YEALD 1.15, 5 GAL/SK,225 SACKS,46
BBL.DISPLACE WIT 33.6 BBL, PUMPED 1 BBL OVER CALCULATED PLUG DID
NOT BUMP. FLOATS HELD. 18 BBL OF GOOD CEMENT TO SURFACE. FCP 210.
NO TOP JOB NECESSARY.

19:30 -02:30 7.00 WOT 1 WAIT ON CEMENT.
02:30 - RELEASE RIG AT 02:30 HOURS.

CALLEDBLMMICHAELLEE ANDCHECKED ON SPUD CALL IN OK.
CALLED BLMJAMIE SPARGER ON 9/t0/08 AT 16:47 HRS FOR RUNNING
CASING ANDCEMENT ON 9/11/08 AT 12:00 HRS.
CALLED REDWASH AND WONSIT VALLYON SETTING SURFACE.

10/21/2008 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 LOC 3 RD MOVE OUT RIG, LOADING SUB AND DERRICK
18:00 - 06:00 12.00 LOC 3 WAIT ON DAYLIGHT

10/22/2008 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 LOC 4 MIAND GENERAL LAYOUTRIG
18:00 -06:00 12.00 LOC 4 GENERAL RU. BACKYARD.ELECTRICAL, HYDRALICS, YELLOW DOG, SPOOL

DRILLINGLINE, KOOMEY, LAYOUT FLARE LINES, CIRCULATE AROUND
STEAM SYSTEM, WIND WALLS, MUD PITS- PICKUP DERRICK

10123/2008 06:00 -18:00 12.00 LOC 4 RAISE DERRICK/ RIG UP FLOOR EQUIPMENTllNSPECT BHA,KELLY/ FIXBOP
RAMS - WASHED HING ON BLINDS

18:00 -00:00 6.00 BOP i NIPPLE UP BOP / MAKE UP KELLY// RIG ON DAY RATE ON 10/23/08 @00:00
AM

00:00 -04:00 4.00 BOP 2 TEST BOP'S / PIPE RAMS 250 PSI LOW 3000 PSI HIGH 10 MIN/TEST / CHOKE
MANIFOLD250 PSI LOW 3000 PSI HIGH 10 MINTTEST/ UPPER KELLYCOCK
250 PSI LOW 3000 PSI HIGH 10 MIN/TEST / SAFETY VAVE250 PSI LOW 3000
PSI HIGH 10 MIN/TEST I BUND RAMS 250 PSI LOW3000 HIGH 10 MIN/TEST /
ANNULAR 250 PSI LOW 1500 PSOHIGH 10 MINITEST / 95/8 SURFACE CSG.
1500 PSI FOR 30 MIN/ INSTALLWEAR RING

04:00 -06:00 2.00 BOP 1 INSTALLFILLUP UNE, TURNBUCKLES, BOP WALKWAYS
10/24/2008 06:00 -07:00 1.00 RIG i RIG SERVICE LUBRICATE RIG & CIRCULATE THROUGH MUD SYSTEM-TEST

07:00 -08:00 1.00 RfG 6 CUT & SUP 160' DRILLLINE
08:00 -09:00 1.00 TRP 1 STRAP & TALLYBHA
09:00 -11:30 2.50 TRP 1 PICK UP & TRIP IN HOLE WI BHA - TAG CEMENT @ 394'
11:30 - 13:00 1.50 DRL 4 DRILLCEMENT F/ 394' TO FLOAT COLLAR @420', DRILL SHOE @46f, DRILL

16' RATHOLE-CEMENT
13:00 -13:30 0.50 DRL 1 DRILL F/ 47T TO 487 10' OF NEW FORMATION
13:30 -14:00 0.50 EQT 2 PERFORM FIT W/ 40 PSI OR 10 PPG EQUIVALANT
14:00 - 19:30 5.50 DRL 1 DRILUNG F/ 487 TO 104f 100'lHR.
19:30 - 20:00 0.50 SUR 1 RUN WIREUNE SURVEY @994' INC. .8 AZI. 83.73
20:00 - 22:00 2.00 DRL 1 DRILLINGF/ 104f TO 138f 170'lHR.
22:00-22:30 0.50 RIG 4 INSTALLROTATINGRUBBER
22:30 -05:00 6.50 DRL 1 DRILUNG F/ 138f TO 2066' 105'lHR.
05:00 -05:30 0.50 SUR 1 RUNWIRELINE SURVEY @2021" INC. 2.9 AZL169.83
05:30 -06:00 0.50 DRL 1 DRILLINGF/2066' TO 2097 62'lHR.

10/25/2008 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 DRL 1 DRILUNG Fl209T TO 2345' W/ ROP OF 55'lHR.
10:30 -1000 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE - LUBRICATE RIG

Printed: 12/23/2008 7:28:34



Questar E & P Page 2 of 3

Operations Summary Report

Well Name:GD 16G-35-9-15 Spud Date: 6/14/2008
Location: 35- 9-8 15-E 26 Rig Release: 11/1/2008
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 57

Date From - To Hours Code S Description of Operatîons

10/25/2008 11:00 - 12:30 1.50 DRL 1 DRILLING F/ 2345' TO 2407 WI ROP OF 41'lHR.
12:30-00:00 11.50 WOT 4 STANDBY FOR DIRECTIONAL TOOLS
00:00 -03:00 3.00 TRP 2 TRIP OUTOF HOLE FOR DIRECTIONALTOOLS / LAYDOWN MONEL DC, MUD

MOTOR, TORQUE-BUSTER, & BIT
03:00 -06:00 3.00 TRP 1 STRAP DIRECTIONAL TOOLS & RIG UP DIRECTIONAL EQUIPMENT

10/26/2008 06:00 -08:30 2.50 TRP i PICK UP DIRECTIONAL TOOLS - SCIENTIFIC DIRECTIONAL
08:30 - 11:30 3.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE FI 103.90' TO 240T
11:30 - 12:30 1.00 DRL 2 SUDE F/ 2407' TO 2418' - 11'
12:30 - 14:00 1.50 DRL 1 ROTATING F12418' TO 2536' W/ ROP OF 79'1HR.
14:00 - 14:30 0.50 RIG i RIG SERVICE
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 DRL 2 SLIDE F/ 2536' TO 2548' - 12'
15:00 - 16:00 1.00 DRL 1 ROTATING F12548'TO 2630' Wl ROP OF 82'lHR.
16:00-16:30 0.50 DRL 2 SLIDEFl2630'TO2642'-12'
16:30 - 17:00 0.50 DRL 1 ROTATING F/ 2642' TO 2723' W/ ROP OF 162'lHR.
17:00 - 17:30 0.50 DRL 2 SLIDE F/ 2723' TO 2733' - 10'
17:30 - 23:30 6.00 DRL 1 ROTATING FI2733' TO 3282' W/ ROP OF 92'lHR.
23:30 - 00:00 0.50 DRL 2 SUDE F/ 3282' TO 3291' - 9'
00:00 -06:00 6.00 DRL 1 DRILLING F/ 3291' TO 3873' W/ ROP OF 97/HR.

10/27/2008 06:00 -07:30 1.50 DRL 1 ROTATING FI 3873' TO 3935' W/ ROP OF 41'lHR.
07:30 - 08:00 0.50 DRL 2 SLIDE F/ 3935' TO 3948' - 13'
08:00 - 13:30 5.50 DRL 1 ROTATING FI 3948' TO 4122' W/ ROP OF 32'/ HR.
13:30 - 14:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIGSERVICE / FUNCTION PIPE RAMS
14:00 - 14:30 0.50 DRL 2 SLIDE Fl 4122' TO 4135' - 13'
14:30 - 17:00 2.50 DRL 1 ROTATING F14135' TO 4215' WI ROP OF 32'lHR.
17:00 - 17:30 0.50 DRL 2 SLIDE F/ 4215' TO 4226' - 11'
17:30 -06:00 12.50 DRL i ROTATING F/ 4226' TO 4474' WI ROP OF 20'lHR.

10/28/2008 06:00 -07:00 1.00 DRL 1 ROTATING F/ 4474' TO 448T W/ ROP OF 13'lHR.
07:00 - 10:30 3.50 TRP 2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE F/ 4487' TO BIT
10:30 - 12:30 2.00 TRP 1 CHANGE BIT & MUD MOTOR / CHANGE MWD / SURFACE TEST MUD MOTOR
12:30 -13:00 0.50 RIG i LUBRICATE RIG /FIX VALVEIN PILLTANK
13:00 -16:00 3.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE TO 4400'
16:00 -17:00 1.00 REAM i SAFETY REAM Fl 4400' TO 448T - NO RESTRICTIONS GOING TO BOTTOM
17:00 - 17:30 0.50 DRL i ROTATING F/ 4487 TO 4495' W/ ROP OF 8'lHR. / BREAKING IN NEW BIT
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 DRL 2 SLIDE FI 4495' TO 4505' - 10'
18:00 -19:30 L50 DRL 1 ROTATING Fl4505' TO 459f W/ ROP OF 57/HR.
19:30 - 20:00 0.50 DRL 2 SLIDE F/ 4591' TO 4604' - 13'
20:00 - 21:00 000 DRL 1 ROTATING Fl 4604' TO 4685' W/ ROP OF 81'lHR.
21:00 - 21:30 0.50 DRL 2 SLIDEF/ 4685' TO 4696' - i f
21:30 - 22:30 1.00 DRL 1 ROTATING FI 4696' TO 4778' W/ ROP OF 82'lHR
22:30 - 23:00 0.50 DRL 2 SLIDE FI 4778' TO 4793' - 15'
23:00 -06:00 7.00 DRL 1 ROTATING F/4793' TO 5244' W/ ROP OF 64'lHR.

10/29/2008 06:00 -08:30 2.50 DRL 2 ROTATING F/ 5244' TO 5338' W/ ROP OF 38'lHR.
08:30 -09:00 0.50 DRL 2 SLIDE Fl 5338' TO 5355' - iT
09:00 - 14:00 5.00 DRL 1 ROTATING F/5355' TO 5493' W/ROP OF 28'lHR.
14:00 - 15:00 LOO RIG 7 ENSIGN SAFETY STAND DOWN MEETING
15:00-15:30 0.50 DRL 1 ROTATINGF/5493'TO549T-4'
15:30-16:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATEUPSAMPLE
16:00 - 16:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:30 -22:30 6.00 TRP 2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE & LAYDOWN DIRECTIONAL BHA
22:30 -23:00 0.50 RIG 7 ENSIGN SAFETY STAND DOWN MEETING
23:00 -02:00 3.00 TRP i PICK UP CORE BBL BHA
02:00 -06:00 4.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE W/ CORE BBL Fl SURFACE TO 2750'

10/30/2008 06:00 -07:30 1.50 TRP 2 PICK UP 3 JNTS. DRILLPIPE / TAG FILL@5492'-5'FILL
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:GD 16G-35-9-15 Spud Date: 6/14/2008
Location: 35- 9-8 15-E 26 Rig Release: 11/1/2008
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 57

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

10/30/2008 07:30 - 16:00 8.50 GEO 2 DRILUNG CORE FI 5497 TO 5506'-9'
16:00 -16:30 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE & CONDITION & MIX& PUMP DRY JOB
16:30 - 20:30 4.00 TRP 2 TRIP OUTOF HOLE W1CORE
20:30 -23:00 2.50 TRP 2 BREAK OUT CORE BBL. & COREING TOOLS /8.4' CORE SAMPLE RESEIVED
23:00 -01:00 2.00 TRP 1 PICK & RUNIN HOLEW1BHA
01:00 -04:30 3.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE Fl 111T TO 5438'
04:30 -05:30 1.00 REAM i SAFETY REAM F/5438' TO 5506'
05:30 -06:00 0.50 DRL 1 ROTATING F/ 5506' TO 5514'

10/31/2008 06:00 -11:00 5.00 DRL 1 DRILLINGFl 5514' TO 5638' W/ ROP OF 25'lHR.
11:00 - 11:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE - LUBRICATE RIG
11:30 -14:00 2.50 DRL i DRILLINGF/ 5638' TO 5700' W/ ROP OF 25'lHR.
14:00 - 14:30 0.50 CiRC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP / MIXDRY JOB
14:30 -19:00 4.50 TRP 2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE Fl5700' TO BIT FOR LOGS
19:00 -20:00 1.00 LOG 1 HOLD SAFETY MEETING & RIG UP HALIBURTON LOGERS
20:00 -23:30 3.50 LOG 1 RUN IN & RUN TRIPLE COMBO LOGS / RIG DOWN LOGERS
23:30 -03:00 3.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE F/ SURFACE TO 5640'
03:00 -04:00 1.00 REAM i SAFETY REAM F/5640' TO 5700'
04:00 -05:30 1.50 CIRC i CIRCULATEBOTTOMS UP / MtXDRY JOB
05:30 -06:00 0 50 TRP 3 HOLD SAFETY MEETING W/ WEATHERFORD LAYDOWN CREW / RIG UP LAY

DOWN CREW
11/1/2008 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 TRP 3 LAYDOWNDRILLPIPE

10:30 -11:30 1.00 OTH BREAK DOWN KELLY
11:30 - 14:00 2.50 TRP 1 LAYDOWN BHA & PULL WEAR RING
14:00 -15:00 1.00 CSG 1 HOLD SAFETY MEETING W/ WEATHERFORD CSG. CREW & RIG UP CSG.

EQUIP.
15:00-20:30 5.50 CSG 2 RUN51/2"CSG.TOS69T
20:30 -21:00 0.50 CSG 1 RIG DOWN CSG. CREW
21:00 -23:00 2.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATEBOTTOMS UP &WAIT ON HALUBURTON CEMENT CREW -LACK

OF COMUNICATION W/ THE GENTLEMEN W/ HALUBURTON. NOTIFIED
HALUBURTON 3 DAYS BEFORE,7 HOURS, 4 HOURS, & 2 HRS. BEFORE
NEEDING THEM ON LOCATION.

23:00 -00:30 1.50 CMT i HOLD SAFETY MEETING W/ HALUBURTON CEMENTERS & RIG UP EOutP.
00:30 -03:30 3.00 CMT 2 CEMENT 5.5" PRODUCTION CASING, SUPER FLUSH-XLC-SBM, 30 BBL,FRESH

WATER=10 BBLS, Hi-FILL SCAVENGER=40 SKS.@t0.5PPG, LEAD==330
SKS@11.0PPG,TAIL CEMENT 330 SKS@i5.8PPG, DISP.407BBLS, BUMPED
PLUG W/ 1500 PSI & HELD 2000 PSI.,1 BBLS BACK, FLOATS HELD

03:30 -04:00 0.50 CSG 7 SET SUPS WI 122KON SLIPS
04:00 -06:00 2.00 BOP 1 NIPPLE DOWN BOP'S & CLEAN PITS

11/2/2008 06:00 - 11:00 5.00 BOP 1 NIPPLE DOWN BOP'S & CLEAN PITS / RIG RELEASED @ 11:00 AM ON
11/1/2008

11:00 -02:00 15.00 LOC 4 RIG DOWN RIG FLOOR, LOWER DERRICK, RIG DOWN BACK YARD / RIG 75%
RIGGED DOWN - WILLBE MOVING UVING QUARTERS THIS AM

01:00 - 06:00 5.00 LOC 4 RIG DOWN RIG FLOOR, LOWER DERRICK, RIG ÐOWN BACKYARD/ RIG 75%
RIGGED DOWN - WILL BE MOVING UVING QUARTERS THIS AM

RECESVED
DEC29 258

DR OFO!L,GA3&MMNG

CONRDTAL
Printed: 12/23/2008 7:28:34
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Operations Summary Report - CO ta gLE Tt ON

Well Name: GD 16G-35-9-15 Spud Date: 6/14/2008
Location: 35- 9-S 15-E 26 Rig Release: 11/1/2008
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 57

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

i1/13/2008 06:00 - t6:00 10.00 TRP 2 COMPLETION
On i1/12/08 @7:00 AM - Change overto tbg equipment. RU rig floor. Wait on tbgto
be delivered. At 3:30 PM, spot tbg trailer. PU, tally& rabbitin hole with5-1/2" csg
scraper & 173 jts 2-7/8" tbg. Tag PBTD @5650'. Roll hole w/ 150 bbis 2% KCL.
SDFN @7:00 PM.

I24 Hour Forecast: POOH wltbg &scraper. Run CBL & perf.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5#
Csg Depth: 5697

11/15/2008 06:00-16:00 10.00 TRP 2 COMPLETION
On 11/14/08 @7:00 AM - POOH wltbg & scraper. RU Lone Wolf wireline,run CBL
from 5650' tosurface. Good cmt to fluid level @450'. Perforate Uteland Butte
formation f/ 5496'- 5503'. RD WL RIH w/ 5-1/2" pkr & 167 jts 2-7/8" workstring. Set
pkr@545T, test to 1000#, good test. RU swab equipment. Swab tbg dry in 5 runs,
recovered 30 bbis waterwl no oil or gas. SDFN@5:00 PM.

24 Hour Forecast: Acidize.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5#
Csg Depth: 569T

11/18/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM i COMPLETION
On 11/17/08 @7:00 AM -0 psi on well. RIH w/ swab, tbg dry, no fluid entry over
weekend. RUSuperior acid crew,filltbg with30 bbis 2% KCLwater. Establish
injection rate of 4-1/2 BPM & 2500 psi, pump6000 gals 15% HCL alternating gelled&
regular acid stages. Displace acid wl 30 bbis 2% KCL. ISIP = 2200 psi, 15 minute
SIP = 1950 psi. RD acid crew, open wellto flat tank,flowback 36 bbis water &acid.
Tbg died. RU swab & recovered 80 bbis fluid,final oil cut 30% w/ a lot of gas. SDFN
@5:00 PM.

24 Hour Forecast Continue to swab.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5#
Csg Depth: 569T

11/1912008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB i COMPLETION
On 11/18/08 @7:00 AM w/ 450 psi SITP. Open wellto pit, bled down in 5 minutes.
RIH w/ swab. 1FL@2000'. Made8 swab runs. Recovered 60 bbis oil & 10 bbis
water,swabbing90 to 100% oilon last 6 runs. Tbg blowing gas for 15 minutesafter
each run. FFL @4000'. Estimated fluid entry rate of 6 BPH. RD swab equipment,
release pkr. POOH w/ 60 stands tbg leaving 23 stands in hole as killstring. SDFN @
5:00 PM.

24 Hour Forecast: POOH. Laydown pkr. R1Hw/productiontbg.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5#
Csg Depth: 569T

11/20/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 BOP 1 COMPLETION
On 11/19/08 @7:00 AM 0 psi SITP, POOH w/ killstring& 5-1/2" pkr. RIH w/
production tbg. RD rig floor, ND BOP;s. Set 5-1/2" B-2 TAC, land tbg on B-1 flange
wl 14000#tension. NU WH & flow lines, change overto rod equipment. Flush tbgw/
70 bbis chemicalwater, well circ last 10 bbis. PU & bucket test new pump - OK. RIH
w/ rods and pump, seat and space out, filltbgw/ 2 bbis water. Long stroke pumpf/
200 to800 psi in 4 strokes, good test,goodtest, good pump action. Clamp rods off
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:GD 16G-35-9-15 Spud Date: 6/14/2008
Location: 35- 9-8 15-E 26 Rig Release: 11/1/2008
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 57

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

11/20/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 BOP 1 wellhead, secure well. SDFN @5:30 PM.

FINALREPORT

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5#
Csg Depth: 5697

Tbg Detail:
KB 16.00
Stretch 1.50
167 Jts 2-7/8" Tbg 5454.22
5-1/2"B-2 TAC (Nabors) 2.73
PSN 1.10
1 Jt 2-7/8" Tbg 33.09
Tbg Tail @ 5508.64

Rod Detail:
1 1/2" x 26' Polish Rod
2 - 8', 1 - 4', 1 - 2' x 7/8" Ponys
86 - 7/8" Slick
130 - 3/4" Slick

Pump: Weatherford
2 1/2" x 1 1/2" x 20 x23 x 25'
RHAC #2377 255' Max Stroke

12/5/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 LOC 4 COMPLETiON
On 12/3108 - Road rig from Flatrock to location.
On 12/4/08 - MIRU Basin Well Service #1. SICP = 0# & SITP = 10#. Hot oiler
pumped 60 bbis 2% KCLdown csg. Unseated pump. Flushed rods with40 bbis 2%
KCL@250 degrees. POOHw/rods & pump. Flushed rods when needed. ND
wellbead assembly. Released tbgA.C. set @ 5474'. NU BOP's. RU tbg equipment.
Tally & RIH w/6 jts 2-7/8" tbg. Tag PBTD @ 5640'. POOH w/ 6 jts. Tbg tail@5503'.

SWIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will POOH w/ tbg& reperforate.

Cag Size: 5-1/2" 15.5#
Csg Depth: 5697'

Perfs:
5496' - 5503'

12/8/2008 06:00 -16:00 10.00 PERF 2 COMPLETION - TIGHT HOLE
On 12/5/08 SICP = 0# & SITP = 0#. POOH w/ productionstring as follows: 167 jts
tbg. TAC, PSN, 1 jt tbg w/ NC. RD tbg equipment. ND BOP's. NU double frac valve
assembly. RU J-W WL Services. Perforate per CBI dated 11/14/08 the following
intervals usinga 4" gun w/ 4 jpf& 90* phasing: 5590-93'; 5490-92'; 5416-24' (52
holes) & existing perfs @5496-5503'. Seen Opressure increase after perforating.
SWIFWE.

24 Hour Forecast: Will frac well.
REC ED

LLTR: 150 bbis

DEC29 203
Di OFO!L,GAS&EN!NG

CONRDENTAtrinted:12/23/2008
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Operations Summmy Report

Well Name: GD 16G-35-9-15 Spud Date: 6/14/2008
Location: 35- 9-S 15-E 26 Rig Release: 11/1/2008
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 57

Date Frorn- To Hours Code C Description of Operations

12/8/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 PERF 2 Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5#
Csg Depth: 569T

Perfs:
5496' - 5503' (reperf)
5590 - 5593'
5490 - 5492'
5416 - 5424

12/9/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 3 COMPLETION - TIGHT HOLE

On 12/8/08 SICP = 0#. MIRU Halliburton frac crew & JW Wireline and frac gross
perforated Green Riverinterval 5416'-5593'down 5-1/2" cag using a Delta 140 2%
KCL X-linked gel watersystem (16#gel) as follows: Breakdown @2060#and frac with
800 gals of 15% HCL followed by a 4500 pad and stage 1-6 ppg 20/40mesh sand in
13000 gals offluid followed by 1000 gais of 6 ppg 16/30 sand and flush with800 gals
of 15% HCL and 4635 gals ofslickwater. Total of 592 bbis of fluid and a totalof
51100#of 20/40 sand and 6000#of 16/30 sand. Max rate = 34.2 BPM; avg rate = 28.3
BPM;maxpsi = 3732#; avg psi = 2508#; ISIP = 2674#{.92). Lubricate in a 5-1/2"
CBP and set at 5350'.
Zone #2: Perforate Green River Interval 4926'-4934' & 5056'- 5070' (88 holes) per the
CBL log dated 11/14/08 at 4 JPF and 90* phasing using a 4" osg gun. Frac gross
perforated interval 4926' - 6070'down 5-1/2" csg using the above system as follows:
Break @2425# and pump a 3500 gal pad and stage 1-6 ppg 20/40 mesh sand in
12000 gals of fluid and followedby 6 ppg 16/30 sand in 1000 gals of fluid and flush
with 800 gals of 15% HCL and 4083 gals of slickwater. Total of 491 bbis and a totalof
38000#of 20/40 sand and 6800#of i6/30 sand. Max rate = 29.8 BPM; avg rate = 27.9
BPM;maxpsi = 2452#; avg psi = 2210#; ISIP = 2229# (.88).Lubricate in a 5-1/2"
CBP and set at 4780'.
Zone #3: Perforate Green River interval 4598' - 4604' & 4736' - 4742' per the above
gun and log at 4 JPF (48 holes). Frac gross perforated Interval 4598'-4742' down
csg using theabove system as follows: Broke@1800# and pump a 4500 galpad and
stage 1-6 ppg 20/40 mesh sand in 13500 gals of fluid followed by a 500 gal stage of 6
ppg 16/30 sand and flush with4556 gals of slickwater. Total of 536 bbis of fluid and a
total of 51130#of 20/40 sand and a totalof 2200# of 16/30 mesh sand. Maxrate =

28.2 BPM; avg rate = 27.6 BPM;maxpsi = 2725#;avg psi = 2448#; ISIP = 2167#
(.90).
Si thewell and RDMO Halliburton & JW Wireline.

24 Hour Forecast Will start clean out ofwell.

LLTR: 1750 bbis

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5# J-55
Csg Depth: 568T

Perfs:
Zone #1- Green River
54t6-24'; 5490-92'; 5496-5503'
5590-5603' (80 holes)
Zone #2 - Green River
4926-34'; 5056-70' (88 holes)
Zone #3 - Green River
4598-4604'; 4736-42' (48 holes)

DE OFOiL,GAS&MENG
Printed: 12/23/2008 12:53:47
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GD 16G-35-9-15 Spud Date: 6/14/2008
Location: 35- 9-S 15-E 26 Rig Release: 11/1/2008
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 57

Date From - To Hours Code S
e Description of Operations

12/9/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 3
12/10/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 DRL 5 COMPLETION - TIGHT NOLE

On AM of 12/9/08 SICP = 300#. Open csg &flowed back 80 bbis of water,well died.
RlHw/ 4-3/4" bit & tbg. Tag sand @4715' &ciro out sand to complete plug @4780' &
drillout plug. Continue in the hole & tag sand @5315'&circ out sand to comp plug@
5350'& drillout plug. DriHedout w/2% KCLwater and had full returns withno oilor
gas. Continue in the hole & tag sand fill@5607 w/ bottom perf @5593'. Ciro hole
clean @560T & pui bit to 5550' & SIFN. On 12/10/08 NOTE: After wen died this
AM,nippled down frac head assembly& NU BOP's. SITP & SICP = 0#. Will clean
out toPBTD.

24 Hour Forecast: WiHclean out to PBTD ofapprox 5650' & POOH wl bit & start to
run production tubulars.

LLTR: 1670 bbis

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5#
Csg Depth: 5697

Perfs:
Zone #1 -Green River
5496' - 5503' (reperf)
5496' - 5503'
5490 - 5492'
5416' - 5424'
Zone #2 - Green River
5056' - 5070'
4926' - 4934'
Zone#3-GreenRiver
4736' - 4742'
4598' - 4604'

12/11/2008 0600 -16:00 10.00 TRP 2 COMPLETlON - TIGHT HOLE

On 12/10/08 SICP = 0#. RiH & tag fillat 5607 and attempt to establish circ and tbg is
plugged. POOH w/ bit & tbg with an obstructionin themiddleof thejointabovethebit.
Could not know out. RIH w/ productiontbg& anchor. Tag @560T and circ out sand
to5611' and very hard. Puu tbg tailto 5468' & SN at 5434' and anchor @5432'. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast Will set anchor and ND BOP's & NU WH & run rods & pump &
return weHto production.

NEW PBTD = 5611' (as of 12/10/08}

LLTR: 1670 bbis

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5#
Csg Depth: 569T

Perfs:

** " ** Uk?hai¶ §(gg Printed: 12/23/2008 12:53:47
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GD 16G-35-9-15 Spud Date: 6/14/2008
Location: 35- 9-S 15-E 26 Rig Release: 11/1/2008
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 57

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

12/11/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 TRP 2 Zone #1 -Green River
5496' - 5503' (reperf)
5496'-5503'
5490 - 5492
5416 - 5424'
Zone #2 - Green River
5056' - 5070'
4926' - 4934'
Zone #3 - Green River
4736 - 4742'
4598'-4604'

12/12/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 TRP 18 COMPLETION - TIGHT HOLE

On 12/11/08 SITP & SICP = 0#. Bucket test new pump. RIH w/ new pump. RIH w/
new pump: 130 - 3/4" plainrods; 87 - 7/8" plain rods & 1-1/2" x 22' polishrod. Seat
pumpand long stroke to 500#and held OK. Hang off well and tum over toproduction
department On AMof 12/12/08 wellis pumping OK. Will RDMO Basin Wei Service
#1 this AM.

FINAL REPORT

NEWPBTD = 5611' (as of 12/t0/08)

LLTR: 1670 bbis

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5#
Csg Depth: 5697

Perfs:
Zone #1 -Green River
5496' - 5503' (reperf)
5496' - 5503'
5490 - 5492'
54‡6' - 5424'
Zone#2 - Green River
5056' - 5070'
4926' - 4934'
Zone #3 - Green River
4736' - 4742'
4598' - 4604'

Tbg Detail
NC 0.44
1 Jt 2-7/8" Tbg 32.53
AC w/ 15M# tension 1.89
167 Jts of 2-7/8" Tbg 5423.56

Tbg Tail@ 5475.50
SN @ 5442.45
AC @ 5441.45

D OFDILGASå MINING

Printed: 12/23/2008 12:53:47
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GD 16G-35-9-15 Spud Date: 6/14/2008
Location: 35- 9-S 15-E 26 Rig Release: 11/1/2008
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 57

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

12/12/2008 06:00 -16:00 10.00 TRP 18 AIIDepths are KB depths
AIItbgis 2-7/8" EUE Brd 6.5# J-55

Rod Detail:
130 3/4" Plain Rods
87 -7/8" Plain Rods
No Ponies
1-1/2"x22 Polish Rod

I
Pump Detail:
2-1/2"x1-1/2"x20x23x25 RHAC (#2340w/maxstroke of 227)

RECERVED
DEC29 200

AA Dii CFOL GAS&MENG

Printed: 12/23/2008 12:53:47



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/14/2010

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N5085-QuestarExploration and Production Company N3700-QEP Energy Company

1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265

Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048 Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048

CA No. Unit:
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

NO TYPE STATUSSEE ATTACHED

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/28/2010
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/28/2010
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/24/20104a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Requested
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 8/16/2010 BIA not yet7. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 8/16/2010

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 6/29/2010

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/30/2010
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/30/2010
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965010693
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965010695
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a
COMMENTS:

QEP Enerav FORMA.xis



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

See attached
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAME:SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS See attached
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° See attacheddrillhorizontal laterais. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL
8. WELLNAMEand NUMBEIROIL WELL GAS WELL O OTHER
See attached

2 NAMEOF o XR Of

tiOn and Production Company $$ $ Att che
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:1050 17th Street, Suite 500 Denver

, CO z, 80265 (303) 672-6900 See attached
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See attached couuTY: Attached
QTR/QTR. SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,MERIDIAN: STATE:

UTAH

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstad CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

6/14/2010 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE
SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFFDate of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: Operator Name
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENTFORMATION Change

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective June 14, 2010 Questar Exploration and Production Company changed its name to QEP Energy Company. This namechange involves only an internal corporate name change and no thirdparty change of operator is involved. The sameemployees willcontinue to be responsible for operations of the properties described on the attached list. AIIoperations willcontinue to be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLM Reference No. ESBOOOO24)
Utah State Bond Number: 965868683
Fee Land Bond Number:
BIA Bond Number: 799446- 9/p O/O(o JS
The attached document is an all inclusive list of the wells operated by Questar Exploration and Production Company. As ofJune 14, 2010 QEP Energy Company assumes all rights, duties and obligations as operator of the properties as described onthe list

d n Regulato0ryAffairs Analyst

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED APPROVED /g
(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side) . .

DIV,OFOIL,GAS&MINING Dmslon of011,GasandMinin
EarleneRussell.Ennineerina



Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
effective June 14, 2010

well name sec twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease

WEST RIVER BEND 3-12-10-15 12 100S 150E 4301331888 14542 Federal OW P CWEST RIVER BEND 16-17-10-17 17 100S 170E 4301332057 14543 FederaÍOW PWEST DESERT SPRING l l-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301332088 14545 Federal OW SGD 8G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333821 Federal OW APD CGD 9G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333822 Federal OW APD CGD 10G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333823 Federal OW APD CGD llG-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333824 Federal OW APD CGD 12G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333825 Federal OW APD CGD 13G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333826 Federal OW APD CGD lG-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333827 16920 Federal OW PGD 2G-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333828 Federal OW APD CGD 7G-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333829 Federal OW APD CGD 7G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333830 Federal OW APD CGD 14G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333831 Federal OW APD CGD 15G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333832 Federal OW APD CGD 16G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333833 16921 Federal OW PGD 1G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333834 Federal OW APD CGD 2G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333835 Federal OW APD CGD 3G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333836 Federal OW APD CGD 4G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333837 Federal OW APD CGD 5G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333838 Federal OW APD CGD 6G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333839 Federal OW APD CGD 8G-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333840 Federal OW APD CGD 9G-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333841 Federal OW APD CGD 10G-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333842 Federal OW APD CGD 15G-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333843 Federal OW APD CGD 16G-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333844 Federal OW APD CGOVT 18-2 18 230S 170E 4301930679 2575 ed ÖÑFEDERAL 2-29-7-22 29 070S 220E 4304715423 5266 Federal GW TAUTAH FED D-1 14 070S 240E 4304715936 10699 Federal GW SUTAH FED D-2 25 070S 240E 4304715937 9295 Federal GW SPRINCE 1 10 070S 240E 4304716199 7035 Federal GW PUTAH FED D-4 14 070S 240E 4304731215 9297 Federal GW SISLAND UNIT 16 11 100S 180E 4304731505 1061 Federal OW SEAST COYOTE FED 14-4-8-25 04 080S 250E 4304732493 11630 Federal OW PPRINCE 4 03 070S 240E 4304732677 7035 Federal OW PGH 21 WG 21 080S 210E 4304732692 11819 Federal GW POU SG 6-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304732746 11944 Federal GW SFLU KNOLLS FED 23-3 03 100S 180E 4304732754 12003 Federal OW PGH 22 WG 22 080S 210E 4304732818 12336 Federal GÑOU GB 12W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304733249 13488 Federal GW POU GB 15-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733364 12690 Federal GW POU GB 3W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304733513 12950 Federal GW PÖÜÜB 7 i-D ÒÌ)iii0E 4304733514 12873 Federal GW PWV 9W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733515 13395 Federal GW POU GB 9W-18-8-22 18 Ã80f220E Ì304733 liššŸ Vedil äW3OU GB 3W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304733526 13514 Federal GW POU GB 12W-30-8-22 3i 080S 220E 4304733670 13380_ Federal GW PWV 10W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733814 13450 Federal GW PGH 7W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733845 13050 Federal GW PGH 9W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733846 13074 Federal GW P
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Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
effective June 14, 2010

well_name sec twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease

GH 11W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733847 13049 Federal GW P
GH 15W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733848 13051 Federal GW P
WV 2W-9-8-21 09 080S 210E 4304733905 13676 Federal GW P
WV 7W-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304733907 13230 Federal GW P
WV 9W-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304733909 13160 Federal GW P
GH 14W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304733915 13073 Federal GW P
OU GB 4W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304733945 13372 Federal GW POÚÐ 9W-19-8-22 19 [080S 3i0È Ã30Ì71Ì94Ì 5593 Federal GW P
OU GB 10W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304733947 13389 Federal GW P
OU GB 12W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304733948 13388 Federal GW P
GB 9W-25-8-21 25 080S 210E 4304733960 13390 Federal GW P
SU lW-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733985 15569 Federal IGW P
SU 3W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733987 13321 Federal OW S
SU 7W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733988 13235 Federal GW P
SU 9W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733990 13238 Federal GW P
SU 13W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 14304733994 13236 Federal GW TA
SU 15W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733996 13240 Federal GW P
WV 8W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734005 13320 Federal GW P
WV 14W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734007 13322 Federal GW S
OU GB 6W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734018 13518 Federal GW P
OU GB 5W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734025 13502 Federal GW P
OU GB 11W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734039 13413 Federal GW P
OU GB 4W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734043 13520 Federal GW P
GH 5W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734147 13387 Federal GW P
GH 6W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734148 13371 Federal GW P
GH 8W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734149 13293 Federal GW P
GH 10W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734151 13328 Federal GW P
GH 10W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734152 Ï3378 Federal GW P
GH 12W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734153 13294 Federal GW P
GH 14W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734154 13292 Federal GW P
GHiÃW-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734157 13329 Federal GW P
WV 2W-3-8-21 03 080S 210E 4304734207 13677 Federal GW P
OU GB 5W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734209 13414 Federal GW P
WV 6W-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304734272 13379 Federal GW P
GH 1W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734327 13451 Federal GW P
GH 2W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734328 13527 Federal GW P
GH 3W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734329 13728 Federal GW P
GH 7W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734332 13537 Federal GW P
GH 9W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734333 13411 Federal GW P
GH 11W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734334 13410 Federal GW P
GH 15W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734335 13407 Federal GW P
GH 16W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734336 13501 Federal GW P
WV 12W-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304734343 13430 Federal GW P
OU GB 13W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734348 13495 Federal GW P
OU GB 14W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734349 13507 Federal GW P
OU GB 11W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734350 13526 Federal GW P
SU PURDY 14M-30-7-22 30 070S 220E 4304734384 13750 Federal GW S
WVX 11G-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734388 13422 Federal OW P
WVX 13G-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734389 13738 Federal OW P
WVX 15G-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734390 13459 Federal OW P
SU BRENNAN W 15W-18-7-22 18 070S 220E 4304734403 13442 Federal GW TA
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Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
effective June 14, 2010

well name see twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease

SU 16W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734446 13654 Federal GW P
SU 2W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734455 13700 Federal GW P
SU 10W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734456 13540 Federal GW P
WV 16W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734470 13508 Federal GW P
OU GB 16WX-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734506 13431 Federal GW P
OU GB lW-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734512 13469 Federal GW P
OU GB 2W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734513 B461

Federal¯ÙW
P

OU GB SW-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734514 13460 Federal GW P
OU GB 7W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734515 13462 Federal GW P
OU GB 8W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734516 13489 Federal GW P
OU GB 11W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734517 13467 Federal GW P
OU GB 16W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734522 13476 Federal GW P
OU GB lW-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734528 13487 Federal GW S
OU GB 3W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734529 13493 Federal GW P
OU GB 6W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734530 13519 Federal GW P
OU GB 7W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734531 13494 Federal GW P
OU GB 8W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734532 13483 Federal GW P
OU GB 9W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734533 13500 Federal GW P
OU GB 6W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734534 13475 Federal GW P
OU GB 10W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734535 13479 Federal GW P
OU GB 13W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734536 13478 Federal GW P
OU GB 14W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734537 13484 Federal GW P
OU GB 15W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734538 13482 Federal GW P
OU GB 12W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734542 13543 Federal GW P
OU GB 6W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734543 13536 Federal GW P
OU GB 13W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734544 13547 Federal GW P
OU GB 6W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734545 13535 Federal GW P
OU GB 3W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734546 13509 Federal GW P
OU GB 13W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734547 13506 Federal GW P
OU GB 4W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734548 13534 Federal GW P
OU GB 5W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734549 13505 Federal GW P
OU GB 14W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734550 13550 Federal GW _P
OU GB 11W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734553 13671 Federal GW P
OU GB 14W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734554 13528 Federal GW P
OU GB 2W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734559 13539 Federal GW P
OU GB 7W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734560 13599 Federal GW P
OU GB 16W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304734563 13559 Federal GW P
OU GB 1W-29-8-22 29 080SE220E 4304734573 13562 Federal GW P
OU GB 7W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734574 13564 Federal GW P
OU GB 8W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734575 13609 Federal GW S
OU GB 9W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734576 13551 Federal GW P
OU GB 10W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734577 13594 Federal GW P
OU GB 15W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734578 13569 Federal GW P
OU GB 2W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734599 13664 Federal GW P
OU GB 2W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734600 13691 Federal GW P
OU GB 15W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734601 13632 Federal GW P
OU GB 16W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734602 13639 Federal GW P
OU GB 16W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734603 13610 Federal GW P
OU GB lW-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734604 13612 Federal GW P
OU GB lW-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734623 13701 Federal GW P
OU GB 9W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734624 13663 Federal GW P
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Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
effective June 14, 2010

well name see twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease

OU GB 10W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734625 13684 Federal GW P
OU GB 9W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734630 13637 Federal GW P
OU GB 10W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734631 13682 Federal GW P
OU GB 15W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734632 13613 Federal GW P
OU WIH 15MU-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734634 13991 Federal GW P
OU WIH 13W-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734646 13745 Federal GW P
OU GB 11W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734648 13822 Federal GW P
OU GB 13W-9-8-22 09 080S 220E 430473468 13706 Federal GW P
OU WIH 14W-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734664 13720 Federal GW P
OU GB 12WX-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734668 13555 Federal GW P
OU WIH 10W-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734681 13662 Federal GW P
OU GB 4G-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734685 13772 Federal OW P
OU GB 3W-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734686 13746 Federal GW P
OU GB 16SG-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734688 13593 Federal GW P
OU WIH 7W-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734689 13716 Federal GW P
OU GB 5W-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734690 13770 Federal GW P
WIH 1MU-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734693 14001 Federal GW P
OU GB 5G-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734695 13786 Federal OW P
OU GB 7W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734705 13710 Federal GW P
OU SG 14W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734710 13821 Federal GW P
OU SG 15W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734711 13790 Federal GW P
OU SG 16W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734712 13820 Federal GW P
OU SG 4W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734713 13775 Federal GW P
OU SG 12W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734714 13838 Federal GW P
OU GB 5MU-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734715 13900 Federal GW P
OU SG 8W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734717 13819 Federal GW P
OU SG 9W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734718 13773 Federal GW P
OU SG 10W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734719 13722 Federal GW P
OU SG 2MU-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734721 13887 Federal GW P
OU SG 7W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734722 13920 Federal GW P
OU GB 14SG-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734743 14034 Federal GW P
OU GB 16SG-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734744 13771 Federal GW P
OU GB 13W-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734754 13774 Federal GW P
OU GB 6MU-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734755 14012 Federal GW P
OU SG 10W-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734764 13751 Federal GW P
OU GB 14M-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734768 13849 Federal GW P
OU SG 9W-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734783 13725 Federal GW P
OU SG 16W-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734784 13781 Federal GW P
SU BW 6M-7-7-22 07 070S 220E 4304734837 13966 Federal GW P
GB 3M-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304734900 14614 Federal GW P
WVX 11D-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304734902 14632 Federal GW P
GB 11M-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304734952 13809 Federal GW P
GB 9D-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304734956 14633 Federal GW P
GB 1D-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304734957 14634 Federal GW P
WRU EIH 2M-35-8-22 35 080S 220E 4304735052 13931 Federal GW P
GH 12MU-20-8-21

_

20 080S 210E 4304735069
_

14129 Federal GW fOU SG 4W-ll-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735071 14814 Federal GW OPS C
OU SG 5W-ll-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735072 14815 Federal GW OPS C
SG 6ML-11-8-22 11 080BOE 4304735073 14825 Federal GW P
OU SG 5MU-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304735076 13989 Federal GW P
OU SG 6MU-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304735077 14128 Federal GW P
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Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
effective June 14, 2010

well name sec twp rng api
,

entity mineral type stat C
lease

SG 12MU-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304735078 13921 Federal GW P
OU SG 13MU-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304735079 13990 Federal GW P
OU SG 9MU-11-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735091 13967 Federal GW P
SG 11SG-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304735099 13901 Federal GW TA
OU SG 14W-11-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735114 14797 Federal GW OPS C
SG 5MU-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304735115 14368 Federal GW P
SG 6MU-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304735116 14231 Federal GW P
SG 14MU-23-8-22 23 |080S 220E 4304735117 14069 Federal GW P
SG 12MU-23-8-22 . 23 080S 220E 4304735188 14412 Federal GW P
SG 13MU-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304735190 14103 Federal GW P
WH 7G-10-7-24 10 070S 240E 4304735241 14002 Federal GW S
GB 4D-28-8-21 28 080S 210E 4304735246 14645 Federal GW P
GB 7M-28-8-21 28 080S 210E 4304735247 14432 Federal GW P
GB 14M-28-8-21 28 080S 210E 4304735248 13992 Federal GW P
SG llMU-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304735257 13973 Federal GW P
SG 15MU-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304735328 14338 Federal GW P
EIHX 14MU-25-8-22 _ 25 080S 220E 4304735330 14501 Federal GW P
EIHX 11MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735331 14470 Federal GW P
NBE 12ML-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304735333 14260 Federal GW P
NBE 13ML-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304735334 14000 Federal GW P
NBE 4ML-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304735335 14215 Federal GW P
SG 7MU-ll-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735374 14635 Federal GW S
SG lMU-11-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735375 14279 Federal GW P
OU SG 13W-11-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735377 14796 Federal GW OPS C
SG 3MU-ll-8-22 11 080S 220E 94304735379 14978 Federal GW P
SG 8MU-11-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735380 14616 Federal GW P
SG 2MU-11-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735381 14636 Federal GW P
SG 10MU-1µ8-22

_ _ 11 080S 220EL4304735382 _ 14979 Federal GW P
SU 11MU-9-8-21 09 080S 210E 4304735412 14143 Federal GW P
OU GB 8MU-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304735422 15321 Federal GW OPS C
EIHX 2MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735427 14666 Federal GW P
EIHX 1MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735428 14705 Federal GW P
EIHX 7MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735429 14682 Federal GW P
EIHX 8MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735430 14706 Federal GW P
EIHX 9MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735433 14558 Federal GW P
EIHX 16MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735434 14502 Federal GW P
EIHX 15MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735435 14571 Federal GW P
EIHX 10MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735436 14537 Federal GW P
GB 3MU-3-8-22 03 080S 220E 4304735457 14575 Federal GW P
NBE 15M-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304735463 14423 Federal GW P
NBE 7ML-17-9-23 _ 17 090S 230E 4304735464 14232 Federal GW P
NBE 3ML-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304735465 14276 Federal GW P
NBE 11M-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304735466 14431 Federal GW P
NBE 10ML-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304735650 14377 Federal GW P
NBE 6ML-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304735651 14422 Federal GW P
NBE 12ML-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304735652 14278 Federal GW P
ÑBE 6ML-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304735664 14378 Federal GW P
NBE 11ML-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304735665 14340 Federal GW P
NBE 15ML-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304735666 14326 Federal GW P
SG 4MU-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304735758 14380 Federal GW P
SG 11MU-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304735829 14486 Federal GW P
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Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
efectiveJune 14,2010

well name sec twp \ Yng api entity mineral type stat C
lease

PJ3 I)S FEE) 03-7-10-18 07 100S 180E 4304735932 14457 Federal (39V S
RB DS FED 14G-8-10-18 08 100S 180E 4304735933 14433 Federal OW P
OU SG 14MU-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304735950 14479 Federal GW PÈÒŸ2MEÑ-8-i4 2 050S34NÈ̂Ï0iŠ605 74¾ Fediai OW P
WIH lAMU-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304736060 14980 Federal GW P
SU 8M-12-7-21 12 070S 210E 4304736096 16610 Federal GW OPS CFIBE4hdL-10 9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736098 15732 Federal 939V P
14EGE8AILe10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736099 15733 Federal (39V P
14EMB16A4L-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736100 14728 Federal (ITV S
SUBW 14M-7-7-22 07 070S 220E 4304736136 15734 Federal GW P
14BE8AILel2-9-23 12 090S 230E 4304736143 15859 Federal GNV S5516D-28-8-21 28 080S 210E 4304736260 14981 Federal GMÏP14BE5AIL-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736353 15227 Feder<d (IMT P
14EGE7hfL,10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736355 15850 Federal (IVV P
14EME3A4L-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736356 15393 Federal (39V P
EIHX 4MU-36-8-22 36 080S 220Ë4304736444 14875 Federal GW P
EI_HX3MU-36-8-22 36 080S BE 4304736445 14860 Federal GW P
EIHX 2MU-36-8-22 36 080S 220E 4304736446 14840 Federal GW S
EIFTKINfD-36-8-22 36 080S 220E 4304736447 14861 Federal 39V P
14BJE7hfL-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736587 16008 Federal (19V P
14BE 8hfL,26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736588 15689 Federal (39V P
FIBE lhdL-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736589 15880 Federal (FYV P14BE2AIL,26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736590 15898 Federal (39V S
NBE 3ML-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736591 15906 Federal GW P
14EGE5hdL,26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736592 15839 Federal (39V P
14E0E9hdi,10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736593 15438 Federal (19V P
14EMSllAILe10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736594 15228 Federal (39V P
IREGE15AdL,10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736595 15439 Federal (ITV P
FIBE2AIL,17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304736614 15126 Federal (39V P14BGE4NIL-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304736615 15177 Federal (JyV P
14BGE6NIL-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304736616 15127 Federal (39V S
14EGE10AIL-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304736617 15128 Federal (19V P
14BE 14AdL-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304736618 15088 Federal (39V P
14E0E9AIL,26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736619 15322 Federal (19V P
NBE 10D-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736620 15975 Federal GW S
NBE 12ML-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736621 4T Federal GW P
NBE 13ML-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736622 15690 Federal GW P
FIBE 14NIL-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736623 15262 Federal (39V P
NBE 16ML-26-9-2 26 090S 230E 4304736624 15735 Federal_ GW P
WF lP-1-15-19 06 150S 200E 4304736781 14862 Indian GW P
SG 3NTU-23-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304736940 15100 Federal GNV P
NBE 5ML-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304736941 15101 Federal GW P
TU 14-9-7-22 070S RE 4304737345 16811 Federal GW OPS C14C-29-15-19 29 150S 190E 4304737541 15178 Indian GW PFIBE2AIL-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304737619 15860 Federal GNV P
GB 16AIL-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304737664 15948 Federal GVV P

ML-5-8-22_ 05 080S 220E_/304738140 Federal GW APD C
WVX 6ML-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304738141 Federal GW ,APD CWVX 1MU-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304738156 Federal GW APD C
GH 8-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304738157 Federal GW APD CWVX 4MU-17À-21 17 080S 210E 4304738190 Federal GW APD C
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Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
effective June 14, 2010

well name \ sec twp rng lapi entity mineral type stat C
lease

WVX 16MU-18-8-21 18 080S 210E 4304738191 Federal GW APD C
GH 7D-19-8-21 19 080S 210E 4304738267 16922 Federal GW P
WF 8C-15-15-19 15 150S 190E 4304738405 17142 Indian GW OPS C
WVX 1MU-18-8-21 18 080S 210E 4304738659 Federal GW APD C
WVX 9MU-18-8-21 18 080S 210E 4304738660 Federal GW APD C
GB 12SG-29-8-22 | 29 080S 220E 4304738766 16096 Federal GW S
GB 10SG-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304738767 16143 Federal GW S
FR 14P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739168 16179 Federal GW P
SU 11M-8-7-22 08 070S 220E 4304739175 Federal GW APD C
HB 2M-9-7-22 09 070S 220E 4304739176 Federal GW APD C
SUMA 4M-20-7-22 20 070S 220E 4304739177 Federal GW APD C
SU 16M-31-7-22 31 070S 220E 4304739178 Federal GW APD C
FR 13P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739226 16719 Federal GW P
SG 11BML-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304739230 ederal GW APD
SG 12DML-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304739231 Federal GW APD C
GB ICML-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304739232 Federal GW APD C
NBE 8CD-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304739341 16513 Federal GW P
NBE 15AD-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304739342 Federal GW APD C
NBE 6DD-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304739343 Federal GW APD C
NBE 6AD-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304739344 Federal GW APD C
NBE 6BD-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304739345 Federal GW APD C
NBE 5DD-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304739346 16574 Federal GW
NBE 7BD-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304739347 Federal GW APD C
NBE 4DD-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304739348 16743 Federal GW P
NBE 10CD-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304739349 16616 Federal GW P
NBE llCD-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304739350 Federal GW APD C
NBE 8BD-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304739351 16617 Federal GW P
NBE 3DD-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304739352 Federal GW APD C
NBE 3CD-26-9-23 26 090S 230Ï4304739353 Federal GW APD C
NBE 7DD-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304739354 Federal GW APD C
NBE 12AD-26-9-23 _ 26 090S 230E 4304739355 Federal GW APD C
NBE 5DD-26-9-23 _ 26 090S 230E 4304739356 Federal GW APD C
NBE 13AD-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304739357 Federal GW APD C
NBE 14AD-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304739358 Federal GW APD C
NBE 9CD-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304739359 Federal GW APD C
FR 9P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739461 17025 Federal GW S
FR 13P-11-14-20 17 140S 200E)4304739462 Federal GW APD C
FR 9P-17-14-20 17 140S 200E 4304739463 16829 Federal GW P
FR 10P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739465 Federal GW APD C
FR 5P-17-14-20 17 140S 200E 4304739509 Federal GW APD C
FR 15P-17-14-20 17 140S 200E 4304739510 Federal GW APD C
FR llP-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739587 Federal GW APD
FR 5P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739588 Federal GW [APD C
FR 9P-21-14-20 21 140S 200E 4304739589 Federal GW APD CFR 13P-21-14-20 21 140S 200E 4304739590 Federal GW APD C
GB 7D-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304739661 Federal GW APD C
GB 15D-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304739662 16830 Federal GW P
WV 13D-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304739663 16813 Federal GW P
WV 15D-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304739664 16924 Federal GW P
FR 14P-17-14-20 17 140S 200E 4304739807 Federal GW APD C
FR 12P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739808 Federal GW APD C
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Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
effective June 14, 2010

well_name sec twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease

FR 6P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739809 16925 Federal GW P
FR 3P-21-14-20 21 140S 200E 4304739810 Federal GW APD C
FR 4P-21-14-20 21 140S 200E 4304739811 16771 Federal GW P
FR 8P-21-14-20 21 140S 200E 4304739812 Federal GW APD C
FR 15P-21-14-20 21 | 140S 200E 4304739815 Federal GW APD C
FR 2P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304740053 Federal GW APD
FR 2P-21-14-20 21 140S 200E 4304740200 Federal GW APD C
WV 11-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304740303 Federal GW APD C
GB 12-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304740304 Federal GW APD C
GH 11C-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304740352 Federal GW APD C
GH 15A-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304740353 Federal GW APD C
GH 10BD-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304740354 Federal GW APD C
FR 11P-21-14-20 21 140S 200E 4304740366 Federal GW APD C
MELANGE Ul 09 140S 200E 4304740399 Federal GW APD C
OP 16G-12-7-20 12 070S 200E 4304740481 17527 Federal OW DRL C
OP 4G-12-7-20 12 070S 200E 4304740482 Federal OW APD C
WF 8D-21-15-19 21 150S 190E 4304740489 Indian GW APD C
WF 15-21-15-19 21 150S 190E 4304740490 Indian GW APD
WF 4D-22-15-19 22 150S 190E 4304740491 Indian (GW \APD |C
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' a United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
TAKE PRIDE'+4

CH 35/ Utah State Office INAM ERICA
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
http://www.blm.gov/ut/st/en.html

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3100
(UT-922)

JUL 2 8 2010

Memorandum

Fr m:

1FrieldhOfficePriaceFie ce Moa Fi

Subject: Name Change Recognized

Attached is a copy of the Certificate of Name Change issued by the Texas Secretary of State and
a decision letter recognizing the name change from the Eastern States Office. We have updated
our records to reflect the name change in the attached list of leases.

The name change from QuestarExploration and Production Company into QEP Energy
Company is effective June 8, 2010.

cc: MMS



State of Utah OPERATORACCT No.Nu3700Division of Oll, Gas and Mining OPERATOR: QEP Energy Company
ADDRESS 11002 East 17500 South

ENTITYACTIONFORM - FORM 6 Vernal, Utah 84078 (435)781-4342

Action Current New Entity API Number Welf Name Q SC TP RG County Spud Date Effective DateCode Entity No.
No.

B 16921 17719 43-0†3-33833 GD 10GA5915 Sti 36 98 16 UIntah 6/14/2008 0128/2010
WELL 1 COMMENTS:GRRV

WELL2 COMMENTS:

WELI 3 CÖMMENTS

WELL4 COMMENTS:

WELLÀCOMMENTS: RECEIVED
AllG10 201ACTIONúÖ0128(See instructions on backof form)

A - Establish newentityfornew weŒ(einglewell only)
B - Add newwelltoexistingentity(groppor unitwell) DIXOFOII.,GAS&MINING
C Re÷assign wellfrom one existing entity toanotherexisting entity Signature
D Re-assignwellfrom oneexistingentityto a newentity
E - Other (explainin commentssection} Office Administrator 6/9/2010

Title DateNOTE:Use COMMENTsectionto explainwhyeach Action Code was selected
Phone No. (435W81-4342



United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT TA E Pmox'
Utah State Office IN KRICA
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO:

http://www.blm.gov

3l60-nUlTU87711X SEP12 2011 S

Certified Mail - Return Receipt Requested - 7007-2560-0000-5769-8529

QEP Energy Company
1050 17th Street, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265
Attn: Raul Chavez

Re: Invalidation of Kraken Unit
Duchesne County, Utah

Dear Mr. Chavez:

In accordance with the Certification and Determination of the Kraken Unit Agreement, said unit
agreement is hereby declared invalid ab initio.

The decision is based on your failure to commence drilling requirements within specified
timeframes as outlined in Section 9 of the Kraken Unit Agreement.

Please advise all interest parties of the invalidation of the Kraken Unit, Duchesne County, Utah.

You have the right to request a State Director Review of our decision as specified in 43 CFR
3165.3. Such request, including all supporting documentation, must be filed in writing within
twenty (20) business days of this notice to State Director (UT-920), Bureau of Land
Management, P.O. Box 45155, Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155. As stated in the regulations at
43 CFR 3165.3(e), a request for State Director Review does no_tautomatically suspend the
decision.

Sincerely,

/s/ Roger L. Bankert
RECEIVED

Roger L. Bankert
Chief, Branch of Minerals SEP14 2011

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&



STATE OF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator: QEP ENERGY COMPANY Operator Account Number: N

Address: 11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH

city VERNAL

state UT zip 84078 Phone Number: (435) 781-4369

Well 1
API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
4301333827 GD 1G-34-9-15 NENE 34 9S 15E DUCHESNE

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

C 17719 6/13/2008
Comments:

Well 2

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
4301333833 GD 16G-35-9-15 SESE 35 9S 15E DUCHESNE

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

C 17719 6/14/2008

Comments:

wellAPI
Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

ACTION CODES:
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) Valyn Davis

B - Add new well toexisting entity (groupor unit well) ease Print}

C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existingentity
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity Si nature
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) egulatory Affairs Analyst 7/30/2012
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