
STATE OF UTAH FORM 3
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING AMENDED REPORT
(highlight changes)

5. MINERALLEASE NO: 6. SURFACE:
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL ML-47051 State

1A. TYPE OF WORK: DRILL REENTER DEEPEN
7. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:

B. TYPE OF WELL: OIL GAS OTHER SINGLE ZONE 2 MULTIPLE ZONE
8. UN AG MENT M

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. WELL and NUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC. BIG SPRING 3-36 GR
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WIL CAT

P.O. BOX 1815 a VERNAL UT 84078 (435) 789-0790 EXPLORATORY \
4 LOCATIONOF WELL(FOOTAGES) 11.MERR/QTARNSECTION, TO NSHIP, RANGE,

ATSURFACE: 2024 FNL 2030 FEL 39.902203 LAT110.177633 LON SWNE 36 10S 15E S
AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONE: SAME ()

14. DISTANCEIN MILESAND DIRECTIONFROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:

32.15 MILES SOUTH OF MYTON, UTAH DUCHESNE
UTAH

15. DISTANCE TO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE(FEET) 16. NUMBER OF ACRES1N LEASE 17. N AMBEROF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:

2024 640 40
18. DISTANCETO NEAREST WELL(DRILLING,COMPLETED, OR 19. PROPOSED OEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:

APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET)
4,450 NM 2308

21. ELEVATIONS(SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATEDATEWORK WlLL START: 23. ESTIMATED DURATION:

6760 GR 30 DAYS

24. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTINGPROGRAM

SIZE OF HOLE CASING SlZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY,YlELD,ANDSLURRY WEIGHT

12-1/4 9-5/8 J-55 36# 500 SEE ATTACHED EIGHT POINT PLAN

7-7/8 4-1/2 J-55 11.6# ,4,450 SEE ATTACHED EIGHT POINT PLAN

25. ATTACHMENTS

VERIFY THE FOLLOWINGARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL ANDGAS CONSERVATION GENEPAL RULES:

WELLPLATOR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLINGPLAN

EVIDENCEOF DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANYOTHER THANTHE LEASE OWNER

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) ayle e R. Gardner TITLE SUlatory Assistant

DATE 4/21/2006

(This space f Sta e only) Appf0vedby the
UtahDivisionof RECEIVEDOil,Gas and Mining

API NUMBERASSIGNED:
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EOG RESOURCES, INC.T10S Ri5E SL B.&M* * • • • Well location, BIG SPRING #3--36GR, located
as shown in the SW 1/4 NE 1/4 of Sectioneros,cap, 36, T10S, R15E, S.L.B.&M. Duchesne County1.7' High,

SB9'46'227 - 2624.78' (Meos.) 58957747 - 262J.95' (Meas.) Poe or stoo., Utah.
ser zoo4Private

,
reto eros, co? -.J R R BASIS OF ELEVATIONAlum. Cap on J/4 0.7' High"),""*,°"'°a• 15 16 SPOT ELEVATIONAT THE NORTHWEST CORNER OF SECTIONEE 3, T11S, R16E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE WILKINRIDGE

QUADRANGLE,UTAH, DUCHESNE COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTE
QUAD. (TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL
SURVEY. SAID ELEVATIONIS MARKED AS BEING 7047
FEET.

B/G SPR/NG /J-- J6GR
Elev. Ungraded Ground = 6764' |

2030' L. N

1910 Brass Cap, 1910 Brass Cap,
-0.8' High 0.8' High

o O - o

- - I---III--i--
SC A LE

----

- N THIS IS TO CERTIFYTHAT THE ABOVE P
FIELDNOTES OF ACTUALSURVEYS M
SUPERVISIONAND THAT THE SAME AND CORRE
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND BE N 1 ~ 9 Ao

REGIS ED AN ÅYOR
REGIS . 161319
STATEset Morked Set Marked Revised: 4-12-06 OFT10S ston, ston. mnmd

T11S WEST - 2640.00' (G.L.O.) NB9°54'10"W
- 2635.34' (Meas.)

' '
ÜNTAH SGINEERING & R SRVEYING

85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078

BASIS OF BEARINGS (435) 789-1017
SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:LEGEND:

BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION. 1" = 1000' 6-1-04 6-4-04L..=
so· SYMBOL (AUTONOMOUSNAD 27) PARTY REFERENCES

D.K. L.M. K.G- G.L.O. PLATO = PROPOSED WELL HEAD· LATITUDE=
39°54'07.93" (39.902203) WEATHER FILEA = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED· LONGITUDE=

110°10'39.48" (110.177633) WARM EOG RESOURCES,
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

BIG SPRINGS 3-36 GR
SWINE, SEC 36, T10S, R15E, S.L.B.&M.

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

1. & 2. ESTIMATED TOPS & ANTICIPATED OIL, GAS, & WATER ZONES:

FORMATION DEPTH (KB)
Uinta FM 12'
Green River FM 310'
Mahogany Oil Shale Bed 1,656'
Garden Gulch MBR 1,71l'
Middle Carb Bed 2,581'
Douglas Creek MBR 3,311'
Castle Peak MBR 4,281'
Uteland Butte MBR 4,616'
Wasatch 4,781'

EST. TD: 4,900' or 120' ± below Wasatch Top Anticipated BHP: 2,420 psi

1. Fresh Waters may exist in the upper, approximately 1,000 ft ± of the Green River Formation,
with top at about 2,000 ft ±.

2. Cement isolation is installed to surface of the well isolating all zones by cement.

3. PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT: Production Hole - 5,000 Psig
BOP Schematic Diagram attached.

4. CASING PROGRAM:
RATING FACTOR

HOLE SIZE INTERVAL M WEIGHT GRADE THREAD COLLAPSE /BURST/ TENSILE
Surface 12-1/4" 0' - 500'KB± 9-¾" 36.0# I-55 STC 2020 Psi 3520 Psi 394,000#

Production: 7-7/8" 500'±- TD 4-½" 11.6# J-55 LTC 4960 Psi 5350 Psi 162,000#
All casing will be new or inspected.

5. Float Equipment:

Surface Hole Procedure (0 - 500' ± Below GL):
Guide Shoe
Insert Float Collar (PDC drillable)
Centralizers: 1 - 5-10' above shoe, every collar for next 3 joints (4 total).

Production Hole Procedure (500' ± - TD):
Float shoe, 1 joint casing, float collar and balance of casing to surface. 4-½", 11.6#, J-55 or equivalent
marker collars or short casing joints to be placed 400' above top of Garden Gulch. Centralizers to be
placed 5' above shoe on joint #1, top of joint #2, and every 2nd joint to 400' above Garden Gulch top.
(15± total). Thread lock float shoe, top and bottom of float collar, and top of 2nd

8 point plan-EOG l
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

BIG SPRINGS 3-36 GR
SWINE, SEC 36, T10S, R15E, S.L.B.&M.

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

6. MUD PROGRAM:

Surface Hole Procedure (0 - 500' ± below GL):
Air/air mist or aerated water

Production Hole Procedure (500' ± - TD):

Anticipated mud weight 9.0 - 9.5 ppg depending on actual wellbore condition
encountered while drilling.

500'± - TD A closed mud system will be utilized. A bentonite gelled water mud system will be used
to control viscosity w/PHPA polymer used for supplemental viscosity and clay
encapsulation/inhibition. Water loss will be maintained at <l5cc's using white starch or
PAC. Bactericides will be used as needed. Anticipated pH will range from 9.0-10.0.
Mud weight will be adjusted as necessary for well control. Deflocculants/thinners will be
used as necessary to maintain mud quality. LCM sweeps will be utilized as necessary to
control lost circulation and mud loss. CO2 contamination, if encountered, will be treated
with lime and gypsum.

7. VARIANCE REQUESTS:

Reference: Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 - Item E: Special Drilling Operations

EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring the blooie line to be 100' in length.
Due to reduce location excavation, the blooie line will be approximately 75' in length

8. EVALUATION PROGRAM:

Logs: Mud log from base of surface casing to TD.
Open-hole Logs: BHC (Schlumberger Borehole Compensated Sonic)

Schlumberger Platform Express w/ Dipole Sonic consisting: of Open-hole gamma ray,
resistively, bulk density, neutron porosity & dipole sonic.

8 point plan-EOG 2
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EIGHT POINT PLAN -

BIG SPRINGS 3-36 GR
SWINE, SEC 36, T10S, R15E, S.L.B.&M.

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

9. CEMENT PROGRAM:

Surface Hole Procedure (0-500'± Below GL)

Lead: 275 sks. (100% excess volume) Class 'G' cement with 2% S1 (CaCl2) & 0.25 pps
D29 (cellophane flakes), mixed at 15.8 ppg, 1.16 ft3./sk., 5.0 gps water.

Top Out: Top out with Class 'G' cement with 2% S I (CaCl2) in mix water, 15.8 ppg, 1.16
ft3./sk., 5.0 gps via 1" tubing set at 25' if needed.

Install 6' x 4' cellar ring, drill rat and mouse holes with spud rig.

Note: Cement volumes will be calculated to bring cement to surface.

Production Hole Procedure (500' ± to TD)

Lead: 120 sks: 35:65 Poz "G" w/ 4% D20 (Bentonite), 2% Dl74 (Extender), 0.2% D65
(Dispersant), 0.2% D46 (Antifoam), 0.75% D112 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2%
D13 (Retarder), 0.25 pps D29 (cello flakes) mixed at 13.0 ppg, 1.75 ft3/sk., 8.8
gps water.

Tail: 640 sks: 50:50 Poz "G" w/ 2% D20 (Bentonite), 0.1% D46 (Antifoam), 0.075% Dl3
(Retarder), 0.2% D167 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant), mixed at
14.1 ppg, 1.28 ft'/sk., 6.0 gps water.

Note: The above number of sacks is based on gauge-hole calculation.
Lead volume to be calculated to bring cement to 200'± above 9-5/8" casing shoe.
Tail volume to be calculated to bring cement to 400'± above top of Garden Gulch MBR.
Final Cement volumes will be based upon gauge-hole plus 45% excess.

10. ABNORMAL CONDITIONS:

Surface Hole (Surface - 500'±):

Lost circulation

Production Hole (500'± - TD):

Sloughing shales, lost circulation and l<ey seat development are possible in the Garden Gulch
Formation.

8 point plan-EOG 3
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

BIG SPRINGS 3-36 GR
SWINE, SEC 36, T10S, R15E, S.L.B.&M.

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

11. STANDARD REQUIRED EQUIPMENT:

A. Choke Manifold
B. Upper and Lower Kelly Cock
C. Stabbing Valve
D. Visual Mud Monitoring

12. HAZARDOUS CHEMICALS:

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA title III in an amount equal to or greater than
10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in association
with the drilling of this well. Furthermore, no extremely hazardous substances, as defined in 40
CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities, will be used, produced, stored, transported, or
disposed of in association with the drilling of this well.

(Attachment: BOP Schematic Diagram)
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EOG RESOURCES CHOKE MANIFOLDCONFIGURATION PAGE20F
W/ 5,000 PSI WP VALVES

3" MIN.1DTO 3" MIN. ID BLEED 3" MIN. ID TO
SEPARATOR, OR PIT LINE O PIT SEPARATOR, OR PIT

MANUAL
CHOKE

ADJUSTABLE

4" 5,000 PSI CHOKE
IJNE FROM HCR

VALVE

Testing Procedure:
1. BOP will be tested with a professional tester to conform to Onshore Order #2.
2. Blind and Pipe rams will be tested to rated working pressure, 5,000 psi.
3. Annular Preventer will be tested to 50% working pressure, 2,500 psi.

Casing will be tested to 0.22 psi / ft. or 1,500 psi. Not to exceed 70% of burst strength,
whichever is greater.

4. All lines subject to well pressure will be tested to the same pressure as blind and pipe
rams.

5. All BOPE specifications and configurations will meet Onshore Order #2
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EOG RESOURCES 11" 5,000 PSI W.P. BOP
CONFIGURATION PAGE 1 OF 2
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eogresources

BIG SPRING 3-36 GR
SW/NE, Section 36, T10S, R15E

Duchesne County, Utah

SURFAcE USE PLAN

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Location Construction: Forty-eight (48) hours prior to construction of location and access
roads.

Location Completion: Prior to moving on the drilling rig.

Spud Notice: At least twenty-four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.

Casing String and Twenty-four (24) hours prior to running casing and cementing
Cementing: all casing strings.

BOP and related Twenty-four (24) hours prior to running casing and tests.
Equipment Tests:

First Production Notice: Within five (5) business days after new well begins or production
resumes after well has been offproduction for more than ninety (90)
days.

For more specific details on notification requirements, please check the Conditions of
Approval for Notice to Drill and Surface Use
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The well pad is approximately 325 feet long with a 246-foot width, containing 1.84 acres
more or less. The well access road is approximately 1848 feet long with a 30-foot right-of-
way, disturbing approximately 1.27 acres. New surface disturbance associated with access
road and the well pad is estimated to be approximately 3.11 acres. The pipeline is
approximately 2,500 feet long with a 40-foot right-of-way, disturbing approximately 2.30
acres.

1. EXISTING RoAos:

A. See attached Wellsite Plats showing directional reference stakes on location, and
attached TOPO Map "B"showing access to location from existing roads.

B. The proposed well site is located approximately31.15 miles south of Myton, Utah -

See attached TOPO Map "A".

C. Refer to attached Topographic Map "A"showing labeled access route to location.

D. Existing roads will be maintained and repaired as necessary.

2. PLANNED ACCESS ROAD:

A. The access road will be approximately 1848' in length. See attached Topo Map "B".

B. The access road has a 30 foot ROW w/18 foot running surface.

C. Maximum grade of the new access road will be 8 percent.

D. No tumoutswillbe required.

E. Road drainage crossings shall be of the typicaldry creek drainage crossing type.

F. No culverts, bridges, or major cuts and fillswill be required.

G. The access road will be dirt surface.

H. No gates, cattleguards, or fences will be required or encountered.

New or reconstructed roads will be centerlined - flagged at time of location staking.

Road drainage crossings shall be of the typicaldry creek drainage crossing type.Crossings
shall be designed so theywill not cause siltation or accumulation or debris in the drainage
crossings nor shall the drainages be blocked by the roadbed. Erosion of drainage ditches by
run off water shall be prevented by diverting water off at frequent intervals by means of
cutouts. Upgrading shall not be allowed during muddy conditions. Should mud holes
develop, they shall be filled in and detours around then
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As operator, EOG Resources, Inc. shall be responsible for all maintenance on cattleguards,
or gates associated with this oil and/or gas operation.

Traveling off the 30 foot right-of-waywillnot be allowed. The access road and associated
drainage structures will be constructed and maintained in accordance with road guidelines
contained in the joint BLlWUSFS publication: Surface Operating Standards for Oil and Gas
Exploration and Development, Third Edition, and/or BLM Manual Section 9113 conceming
road construction standards on projects subject to federal jurisdiction. During the drilling and
production phase of operations, the road surface and shoulders will be kept in a safe and
useable condition and drainage ditches and culverts willbe kept clear and free flowing.

3. LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLs WITHIN A ONE-MILE RADIUS:

A. Abandoned Wells -

0*
B. Producing Wells -

0*
C. Shut-in Wells -

0*
(See attached TOPO map "C"for the location of wells within a one-mile radius.)

4. LOCATION OF EXISTING AND/OR PROPOSED PRODUCTION FACILITIES:

A. On Well Pad

1. Production facilities will be set on location ifthe well is successfully completed for
production. Facilities willconsist of wellhead valves, combo separator-dehy unit
with meter, two(2) 400 BBL vertical tanks and attaching piping.

2. Gas gathering lines - A 4" gathering line will be buried from dehy to the edge of
the location.

B. Off Well Pad

1. Proposed location of attendant off pad flowlines shall be flagged prior to
archaeological clearance.

2. The length of the new proposed pipeline is 2,500' x 40', containing 2.30 acres
more or less. The proposed pipeline leaves the northern edge of the well pad
(ML47051) tumingand proceeding in a southwesterly direction for an
approximate distance of 2,500'. The pipe will tie into an existing pipeline in the
NESW of Section 36, T10S, R15E. Pipe willbe 4" NOM, 0.156 wall, Grade X42,
Zap-Lok, electric weld with a 35 mil X-Tru coating.

3. Proposed pipeline will be a 4" OD steel, welded line laid on the surface

4. Protective measures and devices for livestock and wildlife will be taken and lor
installed where
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Ifstorage facilities/tank batteries are constructed on this lease, the facility/battery or the well
pad shall be surrounded by a containment dike of sufficient capacity to contain, at a
minimum, the entire contents of the largest tankwithin the facility/battery, unless more
stringent protective requirements are deemed necessary by the authorized officer.

The production facilities will be placed on the South side of the location.

All permanent (on site for six months or longer) structures constructed or installed (including
pumping units) will be painted a ilat, non-reflective,earthtone color to match one of the
standard environmental colors, as determined by the Rocky Mountain Five State Interagency
Committee. AIIfacilities will be painted within 6 months of installation. AII existing facilities
will be painted with Carlsbad Canyon. Facilities required to comply with O.S.H.A.
(Occupational Safety and Health Act) will be excluded.

5. LOCATION AND TYPE OF WATER SUPPLY:

A. Water supply will be from Ouray Municipal Water Plant at Ouray, Utah, and/ or
Target Trucking Inc.'s water source in the SWISW. Sec 35, T9S, R22E Uintah
County, Utah (State Water Right # 49-1501. Water willbe hauled by a licensed
trucking company.

B. Water willbe hauled by a licensed truckingcompany.

C. No water well will be drilled on lease.

6. SOURCE OF ÛONSTRUCTION MATERIALS:

A. All construction material for this location and access road willbe of native borrow
and soil accumulated during the construction of the location.

B. No mineral materials willbe required.

7. METHODS OF HANDLING WASTE ÜISPOSAL:

A. METHODS AND LOCATION

1. Cuttings willbe confined in the reserve pit.

2. A portable toilet willbe provided for human waste during the drilling and
completion of the well. Disposal willbe at the Vemal sewage disposal plant.

3. Burning will not be allowed. Trash and other waste material will be contained in a
wire mesh cage and disposed of at the Uintah County Landfill.

4. Produced wastewater will be confined to a lined pit or storage tank for a period
not to exceed 90 days after initial production. After the 90 day period, the
produced water willbe contained in a tank on location and then disposed ofat
one of the following three locations: Natural Buttes Unit 21-20B SWD,
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Disposal, or EOG Resources, Inc. drilling operations (Chapita Wells Unit, Natural
Buttes Unit & Stagecoach Unit).

5. All chemicals willbe disposed of at an authorized disposal site. Drip pans and
absorbent pads will be used on the drilling rig to avoid leakage of oil to the pit.

B. Water from drilling fluids and recovered during testing operations will be disposed of
by either evaporating in the reserve pit or by removed and disposed of at an
authorized disposal site. Introduction of well bore hydrocarbons to the reserve pit will
be avoided by flaring them off in the flare pit at the time of recovery.

The reserve pit will be constructed so as not to leak, break, or allowdischarge. Ifthe
reserve pit requires padding prior to lining (due to rocky conditions) felt padding will be
used.

The reserve pit shall be lined with felt and a 12 millimeterplastic liner.

EOG Resources, Inc. maintains a file, per 29 CFR 1910.1200 (g)containing current
Material Safety Data Sheets (MSDS) for all chemicals, compounds, and/orsubstances
which are used during the course of construction, drilling, completion, and poduction
operations for this project. Hazardous materials (substances) which may be found at
the site may include drilling mud and cementing poducts which are primarily inhalation
hazards, fuels (flammable and/or combustible), materials that may be necessary for
well completion/ stimulation activitiessuch as flammable or combustible substances
and acids/gels (corrosives). The opportunityfor Superfund Amendments and
Reauthorization Act (SARA) listed Extremely Hazardous Substances (EHS) at the site
is generally limited to proprietary treatingchemicals. All hazardous and EHS and
commercial preparations will be handled in an appropriate manner to minimize the
potential for leaks or spills to the environment.

8. ANCILLARY EACILITIES:

None anticipated.

9. WELL SITE LAYOUT:

A. Refer to attached well site plat for related topography cuts and fills and cross
sections.

B. Refer to attached well site plat for rig layout and soil material stockpile location as
approved on On-site.

C. Refer to attached well site plat for rig orientation, parking areas, and access road.

The reserve pit will be located on the West comer of the location. The flare pit will be located
downwind of the prevailing wind direction on the South side of the location, a minimum of
100 feet from the well head and 30 feet from the reserve pit
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The stockpiled pit topsoil willbe stored separate from the location topsoil West of Corner #5.
The stockpiled location topsoil willbe stored west and north of Corner #6. Upon completion
of construction, the stockpiled topsoilfrom the location willbe broadcast seeded with the
approved seed mixturefrom this location and then walked down with a Caterpiller tractor.

Access to the well pad will be from the North.

Corners #2 and #8 will be rounded offto minimize excavation.

FENCING REQUIREMENTS:

All pits will be fenced according to the following minimum standards:

A. Thirty-nine inch net wire shall be used with at least one strand of barbed wire on top
of the net wire. (Barbed wire is not necessary if pipe or some typeof reinforcement
rod is attached to the top ofthe entire fence.)

B. The net wire shall be no more than 2 inches above the ground. The barbed wire
strand shall be 3 inches above the net wire. Total height of the fence shall be at least
42 inches.

C. Corner posts shall be cemented and/or braced in such a manner as to keep the
fence tight at all times.

D. Standard steel, wood, or pipe posts shall be used between the comer braces.
Maximum distances between any two posts shall be no greater than 16 feet.

E. Allwire shall be stretched by using a stretching device before it is attached to the
corner posts.

The reserve pit fencing will be on the three sides during drilling operations and on the
fourth side when the rig moves off location. Pits willbe fenced and maintained until
clean-up.

Each existing fence to be crossed by the access road shall be braced and tied offbefore
cutting so as to prevent slacking of the wire. The opening shall be closed temporarilyas
necessary during construction to prevent the escape of livestock, and, upon completion
of construction, the fence shall be repaired to BLMor SMA specifications. A cattleguard
with an adjacent 16 foot gate shall be installed in anyfence where a road is regularly
traveled. Ifthe well is a producer, the cattleguands (shall/shall not) be permanently
counted on concrete bases. Prior to crossing any fence located on Federal land, or any
fence between Federal land and private land, the operator will contact the BLM,who will
in turncontact the grazing permittee or owner of said fence and offer him/her the
opportunity to be present when the fence is cut in onder to satisfy himself/herself that the
fence is adequately braced and tied
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10.PLANS POR RECLAMATION OF THE SURFACE:

A. Producing Location

Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area will be cleared
of all unused tubing,equipment, debris, materials, trash, and junk not required for
production.

Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons on the pit shall be removed.

If a plastic nylon reinforced liner is used, it shall be tom and perforated before
backfilling of the reserve pit.

The reserve pit and that portion of the location not needed for production
facilitiesloperations will be recontoured to the approximate natural contours. The
stockpiled pit topsoilwillthen be spread over the pit area and broadcast seeded with
the prescribed seed mixture for this location. The seeded area will then be walked
down with a cat.

B. Dry Hole/Abandoned Locadon

At such timeas the well is plugged and abandoned, the operator willsubmit a
subsequent report of abandonment and the UDOGM willattach the appropriated
surface rehabilitation conditions of approval.

11.SURFACE OWNERSHIP:

Surface ownership of the proposed well site access road, and pipeline route is as follows:

Surface: Utah State School and Institutional Trust Lands Administration
Mineral: State of Utah

12. OTHER INFORMATION:

A. EOG Resources, Inc. will inform all persons in the area who are associated with this
project that they are subject to prosecution for knowingly disturbing historic or
archaeological sites, or for collectingartifacts. Ifhistoric or archaeological materials
are uncovered during construction, the operator will immediately stop work that might
further disturb such materials, and contact the Authorized Officer. Within five working
days the Authorized Officer will inform the operator as to:

• Whether the materials appear eligible for the National Register of Historic
Places;

• The mitigationmeasures the operator will likely have to undertake before the
site can be
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• A time frame for the Authorized Officer to complete an expedited review under
36 CFR 800.11 to confirm,throughthe State Historic Preservation Officer,
that the findings of the Authorized Officer are correct and that mitigation is
appropriate.

If the operator wished, at any time, to relocate activities to avoid the expense of
mitigation and/or the delays associated with this process, the Authorized Officer will
assume responsibility for whatever recordation and stabilization of the exposed
materials that may be required. Otherwise, the operator willbe responsible for
mitigation costs. The Authorized Officer will provide technical and procedural
guidelines for the conduct of mitigation. Upon verification from the Authorized Officer
that required mitigationhas been completed, the operator will then be allowed to
resume construction.

B. As operator, EOG Resources, Inc. willcontrol noxious weeds along Right-of-Ways for
roads, pipelines, well sites, or other applicable facilities.

C. The drilling rig and ancillaryequipment willbe removed from the location prior to
commencement of completion operations. Completion operations will be conducted
utilizing a completion/workover rig.

D. Drilling rigs and/or equipment used during drilling operations on this well site willnot
be stacked or stored on Utah State lands after the conclusion of drilling operations or
at any other timewithout Utah State authorization. However, if Utah State
authorization is obtained, it is onlya temporary measure to allow timeto make
arrangements for permanent storage on commercial facilities. (Utah State does not
seek to compete with private industry. There are commercial facilities available for
stacking and storing drilling rigs.)

AIIlease and/or unit operations willbe conducted in such a manner that full compliance is
made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil and Gas Orders, the approved Plan
of Operations, and any applicable Notice of Lessees. The operator is fully responsible for
the actions of its subcontractors. A complete copy of the approved "Application for Permit to
Drill"willbe furnished to the field representative(s) to ensure compliance and shall be on
location during all construction and drilling operations.

Construction activitywill not be conducted using frozen or saturated soils material or during
periods when watershed damage is likely to occur.

If the existing access road, proposed access road, and proposed pad are dry during
construction, drilling, and completion activities,water will be applied to help facilitate
compaction during construction and to minimize soil loss as a result of wind erosion.

A cultural resources survey was performed and will be submitted by Montgomery
Archaeological
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Drill"willbe furnished to the field representative(s) to ensure compliance and shall be on
location during all construction and drilling operations.

Construction activitywill not be conducted using frozen or saturated soils material or during
periods when watershed damage is likely to occur.

If the existing access road, proposed access road, and proposed pad are dry during
construction, drilling, and completion activities,water will be applied to help facilitate
compaction during construction and to minimize soil loss as a result of wind erosion.

A cultural resources survey was performed and will be submitted by Montgomery
Archaeological
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13. LESSEE OR OPERATOR's REPRESENTATIVE AND ÛERTIFICATION:

PERMITTING AGENT DRILLING OPERATIONS
Kaylene R. Gardner Donald Presenkowski
EOG Resources, Inc. EOG Resources, Inc.
P.O. Box 1815 P.O. Box 250
Vernal, Ut 84078 Big Piney, WY 83113
(435) 781-9111 307-276-4865

I hereby certifythat I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the poposed
drill site and access route; that I am familiar with the conditions which currently exist; that the
statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and correct; and that the
work associated with the operations proposed herein will be performed by EOG Resources,
Inc. and its contractors and subcontractors in conformity with this plan and the terrns and
conditions under which it is approved. This statement is subject to the provisions of 18
U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

Please be advised that EOG Resources, Inc. is considered to be the operator of the Big
Spring 3-36 Well, located in the SWNE, of Section 36, T10S, R15E, Duchesne County,
Utah; Federal land and minerals; and is responsible under the terms and conditions of the
lease for the operations conducted upon the leased lands. Bond Comrage is under Bond #
NM 2308.

Date I ne R. ardner Regulatory

BIG SPRING 3-36GR
Surface Use Plan Page 9

13. LESSEE OR OPERATOR's REPRESENTATIVE AND ÛERTIFICATION:

PERMITTING AGENT DRILLING OPERATIONS
Kaylene R. Gardner Donald Presenkowski
EOG Resources, Inc. EOG Resources, Inc.
P.O. Box 1815 P.O. Box 250
Vernal, Ut 84078 Big Piney, WY 83113
(435) 781-9111 307-276-4865

I hereby certifythat I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the poposed
drill site and access route; that I am familiar with the conditions which currently exist; that the
statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and correct; and that the
work associated with the operations proposed herein will be performed by EOG Resources,
Inc. and its contractors and subcontractors in conformity with this plan and the terrns and
conditions under which it is approved. This statement is subject to the provisions of 18
U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

Please be advised that EOG Resources, Inc. is considered to be the operator of the Big
Spring 3-36 Well, located in the SWNE, of Section 36, T10S, R15E, Duchesne County,
Utah; Federal land and minerals; and is responsible under the terms and conditions of the
lease for the operations conducted upon the leased lands. Bond Comrage is under Bond #
NM 2308.

Date I ne R. ardner Regulatory



EOG Resources Inc. :
Big Spring #3-36;

A Cultural Resource Inventory for a Well,
its Access and Pipeline,

Duchesne County, Utah.

By
James A. Truesdale

Principal Investigator

Prepared For
EOG Resources Inc .

P.O.Box 1910
Vernal, Utah

84078

Prepared By
AN INDEPENDENT ARCHAEOLOGIST

P.O.Box 153
Laramie, Wyoming

82093

Utah Project # U-04-AY-1300 (s)

MAR2 1 205
DATE
IN

EOG Resources Inc. :
Big Spring #3-36;

A Cultural Resource Inventory for a Well,
its Access and Pipeline,

Duchesne County, Utah.

By
James A. Truesdale

Principal Investigator

Prepared For
EOG Resources Inc .

P.O.Box 1910
Vernal, Utah

84078

Prepared By
AN INDEPENDENT ARCHAEOLOGIST

P.O.Box 153
Laramie, Wyoming

82093

Utah Project # U-04-AY-1300 (s)

MAR2 1 205
DATE
IN



Table of Contents

Table of contents - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - i
List of Figures - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - ii
Introduction - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 1
File Search - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 1
Environment - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 1
Big spring #3-36 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 3
Field Methods - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 5
Results - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 6
Isolate U-04-AY-1300(s)-1 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 6
Isolate U-04-AY-1300(s)-2 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 7
Recommendations - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 7
References Cited - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 9

Table of Contents

Table of contents - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - i
List of Figures - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - ii
Introduction - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 1
File Search - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 1
Environment - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 1
Big spring #3-36 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 3
Field Methods - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 5
Results - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 6
Isolate U-04-AY-1300(s)-1 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 6
Isolate U-04-AY-1300(s)-2 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 7
Recommendations - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 7
References Cited - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 9



List of Figures

Figure 1. Location of the EOG Resources Inc . proposed Big Spring#3-36 well, its access and pipeline on 7.5'/1996 USGSquadrangle map Gilsonite. Draw, Duchesne County, Utah.2
Figure 2. View to northeast at the Big Spring #3-36 wellcenterstake and well pad area. - - - - - - - - - - - 4

List of Figures

Figure 1. Location of the EOG Resources Inc . proposed Big Spring#3-36 well, its access and pipeline on 7.5'/1996 USGSquadrangle map Gilsonite. Draw, Duchesne County, Utah.2
Figure 2. View to northeast at the Big Spring #3-36 wellcenterstake and well pad area. - - - - - - - - - - - 4



Introduction

An Independent Archaeologist (10:A), was contacted by areprese:atative of EOG Resources Inc., to conduct a culturalresources survey investigation of the Big Spring #3-36 well'sproposed pipeline. The well location is the SW/NE 1/4 of Section36, T10S, R15E (Alt.#1; 2024' FNL, 2030' FWL), Duchesne County,Utah CPigure 1).

The Universal Transverse Mercator CUTM) centroid coordinatefor the proposed Big spring #3-36 well centerstake is Zone 12,North American Datum (NAD) 83, 05/70/235.16 mE 44/17/222.71 mN +5m.

The proposed access and pipeline parallel each other and trend2000 feet (609.7 m) to the northeast.

The proposed Big Spring #3-36 well, its access and pipelineare located in Section 36 of T105 R15E. A total of 19.18 (10block, 9.18 linear) acres was surveyed in Section 36 of T10S R15E.Section 36 of T10S R15E is administered by the State of Utah, UtahSchool and Institutional State Trust Land Administration (SITLA).The field work was conducted on November 11, 2004 by AIAarchaeologists James Truesdale and Cody C. Newton. All the fieldnotes and maps are located in the AIA office in Laramie, Wyoming.

File Search

A GIS file search was conducted by the Utah Division of StateHistory (UDSH), Antiquities section, Records Division on November1, 2004. A update of AIA's Wilkin Ridge, Gilsonite Draw, CowboyBench and Pinnacle Canyon quadrangle maps was updated from theUDSH'S quadrangle data base Wilkin Ridge, Gilsonite Draw, CowboyBench and Pinnacle Canyon maps. In addition, a file search wasconducted at the Vernal BLM office in October 2004 by the author.The UDSH GIS file search indicates that no new cultural resourcemanagement (CRM) projects have been conducted in the immediateproject area. AIA records also indica.te that no CRM projects havebeen previously conducted and or cultural materials (sites,isolates' have been previously recorded.

Environment

Physiographically, the project is situated in the Wilkin Ridgeand Big Wash area 9 miles west of the Little Desert and 16 milessouth of the Myton, Utah. The Bad Land Cliffs are adjacent
immediately south of the general project area. This portion of theLittle Desert area is situated 6 1 2 miles west of the Green River.The Uinta Baain is structurally the lowest part of the ColoradoBlateau tyeographi cal province ( Thornbury 19 6 &t4 2 5 . The WintaBasin is A large, relat.ixely flat, how hapeds east-west
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asymmetrical syncline near the base of the Uinta Mountains. Thetopography is characteristic of sloping surfaces that inclinenorthward and are mainly dip slopes on the harder layers of GreenRiver and Uinta Formations (Stokes 1986), A thick section of morethan 9000 feet (2743.9 m) of early Tertiary rocks are exposed(Childs 1950). These rocks are mainly Paleocene and Eocene in ageand consist of sandstone, clay and shale lacustrine, fluviatile,and deltaic continental deposits, most famous of which are thelacustrine Green River Beds.

The immediate project area is situated on the high benches andridges associated with Big Wash in the Little Desert area 4 milessouth of Wilkin Ridge. Sediments in the project area are dominatedby shallow (<10 cm) sandy clay loam colluvium mixed with angularpieces of Uintah formation sandstone, and smaller pieces of claysand shales. The project area contains exposures of desert hardpanthat are covered with aeolian sand which may reach a depth of over50 to 100 centimeters in areas.

Vegetation in the Big Wash and Wilkin Ridge area ischaracteristic of a Pinyon pine/juniper community dominating thehills and ridges, while a low sagebrush community can be foundalong the washes, on the low hilla and open parks. Speciesobserved in the project area include; Pinyon pine (Pinus edulis),juniper (Juniperus osteosperma), shadescale (Atriplexconfertifolia), saltbush ( grigle;g nuttallii), rabbitbrush(Chrysothamnus viscidiflorus) . big sagebrush (A_r_te_mtridentata) , budsage (Artemesia spige&ggg) , Mormon tea (ERhmáranevadensis(, winterfat (Eurotia lanata), greasewood (Sarcobatusbaileyi) , wild buckwheat (Er_igonum ovvalifolium) , desert trumpet(Erigonum inflatum), desert globemallow (Bromus tectorum), SegoLily (Calochortus Nuttalli), western wheatgrass (Agropyronsmithii), sandberg bluegrass (Poa sandbergii), junegrass (Koeleriacristata), needle and thread grass Ji i comata), desert needlegrass ($;;ipa speciosa) , peppergrass (Le igum spp.) , cheatgrass(Bromus tectorum) , lupine (gp_inus spp.) , Hood's phlox (Phloxhoodii) , Indian paintbrush (C_ast_il_Leja chromosa) , larkspur(Delphinium spp., phacelia (Phacelia adengghora), Russian thistle(Salsola kali), barrel and prickly pear cactus (Regagia spp.). Inaddition, a riparian community dominated by cottonwood (Populasspp.), willow (Salix spp.), greasewood and weedy salt cedar(Tamerix pentandra) may be found along the Green River 12 miles tothe east.

Big Wash #3-36

The Big Wash #3-36 well is situated on top of a low broadsouthwest to northeast trending ridge (Figure 2). The ridge is thenortheast drainage of a much larger upland hillfridger system.
Sediments are colluviaL in natura. Sediments on the well
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loosely compacted, sandy clay loam that is mixed with tiny to small
sized angular/tabular pieces of sandstone, clay and shale. Exposed
and eroding clay and shale bedrock dominates the immediate well pad
area. Vegetation is dominated by dense stands of Pinyon pine and
juniper with a understory of low sagebrush, budsage, saltbush,
bunchgrasses (cheatgrass, indian rice grass, crescent wheatgrass),
and prickly pear cactus.

Figure 2. View to northeast at the 3ig Spring #3-36 well centerstake and
well pad area.

; Exposures of Uinta formation sandstone, clays and shales can
be found on the surrounding hill and ridge slopes and along the
drainage washes and their canyons. The proposed well location is
located at an elevation of 6740.4 feet (2055 m) AMSL.

From the existing Big Spring #4-35 well, the proposed access
and pipeline parallel each other 2000 feet (609.7 m) northeast to
the Big Spring #3-36 well pad. From the existing Big Spring #3-36
well pad, the access and pipeline trend northeast down the crest of
a flat broad southwest to northeast trending ridge to the proposed
Big Spring #3-36. The access and pipeline trend through a dense
foreat of pinyon pine and juniper. Eroding slopes and cutbanks
indicate that sediments along the proposed access are colluvial in
nat·nre. These colluvial deposits are shallow (<5 cm), tan to light
brown, poorly sorted, loosely compacted, sandy clay loam
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that is mixed with tiny to small sized flat angular pieces of Uintaformation sandstone, and smaller pieces of clays and shales. Areasalong the access exhibit exposed and eroding clay and shale(bedrock).

Field Methods

A 10 acre area was surveyed around the centerstake of theproposed well location to allow for relocation of the pad ifnecessary. The survey was accomplished by walking pedestriantransects spaced no more than 15 and 20 meters apart. The proposedaccess and pipeline parallel each other. Each of these linearcorridors surveyed is 2000 feet (609.7 m) long and 100 feet (30.4m) wide, 4.59 acres. The linear corridor surveyed is covered by apedestrian zig-zag transect, 50 feet (15.2 m) wide on either sideof the proposed access and pipeline centerstake. Thus a total of9.18 linear acres was surveyed.

Geologic landforms (rockshelters, alcoves, ridge tops andsaddles) and areas of subsurface exposure (ant hills, blowouts,rodent burrow holes, eroding slopes and cutbanks) were examinedwith special care in order to locate cultural resources (sites,isolates) and possibly help assess a sites sedimentary integrityand potential for the presence and/or absence of buried intactcultural deposits. The entire surface area of ridge tops werecovered. All exposures of sandstone cliff faces, alcoves or
rockshelters, and talus slopes were surveyed.

When cultural materials are discovered, a more thorough surveyof the immediate vicinity is conducted in order to locate anyassociated artifacts and to determine the horizontal extent(surface area) of the.site. If no other artifacts are locatedduring the search then the initial artifact was recorded as anisolated find. At times, isolated formal tools (typical endscrapers, prójectile points) were drawn and measured. The isolatewas then described and its location plotted on a U.S.G.S.topographic map and UTM coordinates are recorded.

When sites are found a Intermountain Antiquities ComputerSystem (IMACS) form was used to record the site. At all sites,selected topographic features, site boundaries, stone tools andcultural features (hearths, foundations, trash dumps and trails)are mapped. Sites were mapped with a Brunton compass, TrimbleGeophysical III, and/or Garmin E-Trex Legend or GPS III plus, andpacing off distances from a mapping station (datum, PVC withaluminum tag). All debitage is inventoried using standardrecording techniques (Truesdale 1995 st al 1995:7) according tomaterial type, basic flake type, and so on. Selected (mostlycomplete stone tools and pro actila po ata at dräWri
änŒ¾ëaëüred.¯

All featurea (rockart panel a) , heartha, foundationsy trash dumpsand L alla), are meamured and de=oribacò walle selected teatures
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are either drawn or photographed.

Site location data is recorded by a Trimble Geophysical IIIand GARMIN E-Trex Legend or GPS III plus Global Positioning System(GPS). Site elevation and Universal Tränsverse Mercator (mat) griddata, its Estimated Position Error (EPE) and Dilution of Precision(DOP) were recorded. Using the GPS data, the site location wasthen placed on a USGS 7.5' quadrangle map.

Results

A total of 19.18 (10 block and 9.18 linear) acres weresurveyed for cultural resources on and around the EOG ResourcesInc. Big Spring #3-36 well centerstake, and along its access andpipeline. Two isolates (U-04-AY-1300(s)- 1 and 2) were recordedduring the survey. Both isolates are located 100 feet (30.2 m)northwest of the proposed access and pipeline corridor. Both of theisolates are considered to be :non-_significant. .Subsequentconstruction of the access and pipeline will not impact theisolates.

Modern trash (plastic soda pop bottles, green, clear and brownbottle glass fragments, miscellaneous metal, wire, and foaminsulation) can be found scattered aronnel the existing wells andalong the existing oil and gas field service road (access) in theWilkin Ridge/Big Wash area.

In addition, the S 1/2 of Section 36 in T10S R15E has beensubjected to vegetation removal activities (chaining and treecutting). The area is littered with sanitary food cans, plasticsoda pop and bar chain oil bottles, oil cans, miscellaneous metalobjects, wire and tires. The area e.khibits several concentrationsand piles of cut pinyon and juniper tress. Several small two trackroada cross the southern half of this meetion (Sec. 36, T10s R15E).

Isolates

Isolate: U-04-AY-1300(s)-1
Location: C/S/SE/SE/NW 1/4 of Section 36, T10S R15E (Figure 1)UTM Coordinate: Zone 12, NAD 83, S 70/043.18 mE 44/17/904.82 mN +5m

Setting: The isolate is situated on top of a large broad flatsouthwest to northeast trending ridge, Sediments on the ridge andsurrounding the isolate consist of shallow (<5 cm), tan to lightbrown, poorly sorted, loosely compacted sandy clay loammixedwithtiny to small angular pieces of sandatone, clay and shale. Thearea surrounding the isolate also exh cius areas with exposed anderoding clay and shale bedrock. Ve station consists of denseginyon gine and juniper with -a- spars÷ siers tery of low sagebrush,budsage salthush yngca, hunchgpasse aniprickly paar
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A total of 19.18 (10 block and 9.18 linear) acres weresurveyed for cultural resources on and around the EOG ResourcesInc. Big Spring #3-36 well centerstake, and along its access andpipeline. Two isolates (U-04-AY-1300(s)- 1 and 2) were recordedduring the survey. Both isolates are located 100 feet (30.2 m)northwest of the proposed access and pipeline corridor. Both of theisolates are considered to be :non-_significant. .Subsequentconstruction of the access and pipeline will not impact theisolates.

Modern trash (plastic soda pop bottles, green, clear and brownbottle glass fragments, miscellaneous metal, wire, and foaminsulation) can be found scattered aronnel the existing wells andalong the existing oil and gas field service road (access) in theWilkin Ridge/Big Wash area.

In addition, the S 1/2 of Section 36 in T10S R15E has beensubjected to vegetation removal activities (chaining and treecutting). The area is littered with sanitary food cans, plasticsoda pop and bar chain oil bottles, oil cans, miscellaneous metalobjects, wire and tires. The area e.khibits several concentrationsand piles of cut pinyon and juniper tress. Several small two trackroada cross the southern half of this meetion (Sec. 36, T10s R15E).

Isolates

Isolate: U-04-AY-1300(s)-1
Location: C/S/SE/SE/NW 1/4 of Section 36, T10S R15E (Figure 1)UTM Coordinate: Zone 12, NAD 83, S 70/043.18 mE 44/17/904.82 mN +5m

Setting: The isolate is situated on top of a large broad flatsouthwest to northeast trending ridge, Sediments on the ridge andsurrounding the isolate consist of shallow (<5 cm), tan to lightbrown, poorly sorted, loosely compacted sandy clay loammixedwithtiny to small angular pieces of sandatone, clay and shale. Thearea surrounding the isolate also exh cius areas with exposed anderoding clay and shale bedrock. Ve station consists of denseginyon gine and juniper with -a- spars÷ siers tery of low sagebrush,budsage salthush yngca, hunchgpasse aniprickly paar



Description: Isolate U-04-AY-1300(s)-1 consists of two pieces ofchipped stone debitage. The debitage is represented by one primaryand one secondary flake. Both pieces of debitage are made from atan, light to dark brown (banded) chert.

Sediments surrounding the isolate consist of shallow (<5 cm),tan to light brown, poorly sorted, loosely compacted, sandy clayloam mixed with tiny to small angular pieces of sandstone, clay andshale. The possibility of buried and intact cultural materialsassociated with the isolate is low.

No additional artifacts (debitage, chipped and ground stonetools) or features (firepits, rock cairns) were recorded inassociation with the isolated pieces of debitage. The isolate isconsidered to be n_on-significant.

Isolate: U-04-AY-1300(s)-2
Location: C/NW/SW/SW/NE 1/4 of Section 36, T10S R15E (Figure 1)UTM Coordinate: Zone 12, NAD 83, 5/70/198.62 mE 44/17/053.51 mN ±5m

Setting: The isolate is situated on top of a large broad flatsouthwest to northeast trending ridge. Sediments on the ridge andsurrounding the isolate consist of shallow {<5 cm), tan to lightbrown, poorly sorted, loosely compacted, sandy clay loam mixed withtiny to small angular pieces of sandstone, clay and shale. Thearea surrounding the isolate also exhibits areas with exposed anderoding clay and shale bedrock- Vegetation consists of densepinyon pine and juniper with a sparse understory of low sagebrush,budsage, saltbush, yucca, bunchgrasses, and prickly pear cactus.The elevation is 6760.08 feet {2061 m) AMSL.

Deacription: _Isolate U-04-AY-1300(s)-21 consists of one piece ofchipped stone debitage. The debitage is represented by a secondaryflake made from a tan, light to dark brown (banded) chert.

Sediments surrounding the isolate consist of shallow (<5 cm),tan to light brown, poorly sorted, loosely compacted, sandy clayloam mixed with tiny to small angular pieces of sandstone, clay andshale. The possibility of buried and intact cultural materialsassociated with the isolate is low.

No additional artifacts (debitage, chipped and ground stonetools) or features (firepits, rock cairns) were recorded inassociation with the isolated pieces of debitage. The isolate isconsidered to be non_-significant.

Recommendations

A total vf 19.18 (10 block and 9.18 linear) acres weresurveyed for cultural resources on and arounŒ the ROG Resbürded-Trre--Si ihTikW ind along its access and
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pipeline. Two isolates (U-04-AY-1300(s)- 1 and 2) were recordedduring the survey. Both isolates are located 100 feet (30.2 m)northwest of the proposed access and pipeline corridor. Both of theisolates are considered to be gen-significant
. Subsequentconstruction of the access and pipeline will not impact theisolates.

Modern trash (plastic soda pop bottles, green, clear and brownbottle glass fragments, miscellaneous metal, wire, and foaminsulation) can be found scattered around the existing wells andalong the existing oil and gas field service road (access) in theWilkin Ridge/Big Wash area.

In addition, the S 1/2 of section 36 in T10S R15E has beensubjected to vegetation removal activities (chaining and treecutting). The area is littered with sanitary food cans, plasticsoda pop and bar chain oil bottles, oil cans, miscellaneous metalobjects, wire and tires. The area exhibits several concentrationsand piles of cut pinyon and juniper trees. Several small two trackroads cross the southern half of this rection (Sec. 36, T108 R15E).
No additional historic and/or prehistoric cultural resources(sites, isolates) were located during the survey.

Sediments on the proposed Bìg Spring #3-36 well pad and alongi-ts access and pipeline corridors are colluvial in nature. Thesediments are shallow (<15 cm). Observation of eroding slopes,cutbanks, and rodent burrow holes on and surrounding the Big Spring#3-36 well pad, and along its access and pipeline indicate that thepossibility for buried cultural resources is low.

Therefore, no additional archaeological work is necessary andclearance is recommended for subsequent construction of the BigSpring #3-36 well, its access and pipeline.
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In addition, the S 1/2 of section 36 in T10S R15E has beensubjected to vegetation removal activities (chaining and treecutting). The area is littered with sanitary food cans, plasticsoda pop and bar chain oil bottles, oil cans, miscellaneous metalobjects, wire and tires. The area exhibits several concentrationsand piles of cut pinyon and juniper trees. Several small two trackroads cross the southern half of this rection (Sec. 36, T108 R15E).
No additional historic and/or prehistoric cultural resources(sites, isolates) were located during the survey.

Sediments on the proposed Bìg Spring #3-36 well pad and alongi-ts access and pipeline corridors are colluvial in nature. Thesediments are shallow (<15 cm). Observation of eroding slopes,cutbanks, and rodent burrow holes on and surrounding the Big Spring#3-36 well pad, and along its access and pipeline indicate that thepossibility for buried cultural resources is low.

Therefore, no additional archaeological work is necessary andclearance is recommended for subsequent construction of the BigSpring #3-36 well, its access and pipeline.
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United States Department of the Interior

BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3160
(UT-922)

May 3, 2006

Memorandum

To: Assistant District Manager Minerals, Vernal District

From: Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer

Subject: 2006 Plan of Development Big Wash (Deep) Unit, Duchesne
County, Utah.

Pursuant to email between Diana Whitney, Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, and Mickey
Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land Management, the followingwell is
planned for calendar year 2006 within the Big Wash (Deep) Unit, Duchesne County,
Utah.

API# WELLNAME LOCATION

(Proposed PZ Wasatch)

43-013-33168 Big Spring 3-36 GR Sec 36 T10S R15E 2024 FNL 2030 FEL

This officehas no objection to permitting the well at this time.

Is/ Michael L. Coulthard

bcc: File - Big Wash Unit
Division of Oil Gas and Mining
Central Files
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid
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RFCEIVED
STATEOFUTAH FORM3

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES MAY24 2006
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING AMENDED REPORT

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING(highlight changes)

5. MINERALLEASE NO: 6. SURFACE:

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL ML-47051 State

1A. TYPE OF WORK: DRILL REENTER O DEEPEN
7. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:

B. TYPE OF WELL: OIL GAS OTHER SINGLE ZONE MULTIPLEZONE
8. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC. BIG SPRING 3-36 GR
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

P.O. BOX 1815 civv VERNAL STATE UT ZIP 84078 (435) 789-0790 EXPLORATORY
4. LOCATIONOF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP. RANGE.

MERIDIAN:

ATSURFACE: 2024 FNL 2030 FEL 39.902203 LAT110.177633 LON SWNE 36 10S 15E S
AT PROPOSED PRODUCINGZONE: SAME

14. DISTANCE IN MILESAND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:

32.15 MILES SOUTH OF MYTON,UTAH DUCHESNE
UTAH

15. DISTANCETO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE(FEET) 16. NUMBEROF ACRES IN LEASE: 17. N JMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:

2024 640 40
18. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING,COMPLETED, OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:

APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET)
4,850 NM2308

21. ELEVATIONS(SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATE DATE WORK WIL. START: 23. ESTIMATEDDURATION:

6760 GR 30 DAYS

24. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

SIZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY,YlELD,AND SLURRY WEIGHT

12-1/4 9-5/8 J-55 36# 500 SEE ATTACHED EIGHT POINT PLAN

7-7/8 4-1/2 J-55 11.6# 4,450 SEE ATTACHED EIGHT POINT PLAN

25. ATTACHMENTS

VERIFYTHE FOLLOWINGARE ATTACHED INACCORDANCE WITHTHE UTAHOIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES:

WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LlCENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLINGPLAN

EVIDENCE OF DIVISIONOF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER FORM 5 IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANY OTHER THANTHE LEASE OWNER

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) Kaylpne R. Gardner TITLE Regulatory Assistant

SIGNA a a a DATE 4/21/2006

(This space for State ue ly)

API NUMBERASSIGNED: APPROVAL

(11/2001) (See Instructions on Reverse

RFCEIVED
STATEOFUTAH FORM3

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES MAY24 2006
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING AMENDED REPORT

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING(highlight changes)

5. MINERALLEASE NO: 6. SURFACE:
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1A. TYPE OF WORK: DRILL REENTER O DEEPEN
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4. LOCATIONOF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP. RANGE.
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RFCEIVED
STATE OF UTAH FORM 3

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES MM24 2006
DIVISIONOF OIL GAS AND MINING AMENDED REPORT Ü

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING(highlight changes)
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

BIG SPRING 3-36GR
SWINE, SEC. 36, T10S, R15E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

1. & 2. ESTIMATED TOPS & ANTICIPATED OIL, GAS, & WATER ZONES:

FORMATION TVD-RKB(ft} Objective Lithology

Uinta FM 12
Green River FM 310

Mahogany Oil Shale Bed 1,656
Garden Gulch MBR 1,711 Secondary Oil / Gas

Middle Carb Bed 2,581
Douglas Creek MBR 3,311 Secondary Oil / Gas

Castle Peak MBR 4,281 Primary Oil / Gas
Uteland Butte MBR 4,616 Primary Oil / Gas

Wasatch 4,787

TD 5,600

EST. TD: 4,850' or 200' ± below Wasatch Top Anticipated BHP: 2,400 Psig

1. Fresh Waters may exist in the upper, approximately 1,000 ft ± of the Green River Formation,
with top at about 2,000 ft ±.

2. Cement isolation is installed to surface of the well isolating all zones by cement.

3. PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT: Production Hole - 5,000 Psig
BOP Schematic Diagram attached.

4. CASING PROGRAM:

M g Slze WEIGHT Grade Threqd a a
CASING Size Co.llap_se Burst Tensile

Conductor 17 ½" 0 - 45' 13 ¾" 48.0# H-40 STC 770 PSI 1730 PSI 322,000#

45' - 500'
Surface 12 ¼" KB± 9-%" 36.0# J-55 STC 2020 PSI 3520 Psi 394,000#

Production 7-7/8" Surface - TD 4-½" 11.6# J-55 LTC 4960 PSI 5350 Psi 162,000#

All casing will be new or inspected.

8 point plan-EOG l
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EIGHT POINT PLAN 4

BIG SPRING 3-36GR
SWINE, SEC. 36, T10S, R15E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

5. Float Eauipment:

Surface Hole Procedure (0 - 500' ± Below GL):
Guide Shoe
Insert Float Collar (PDC drillable)
Centralizers: 1 - 5-10' above shoe, every collar for next 3 joints(4 total).

Production Hole Procedure (500' ± - TD):

Float shoe, 1 jointcasing, float collar and balance of casing to surface. 4-½", l1.6#, J-55 or equivalent
marker collars or short casing joints to be placed 400' above top of Garden Gulch. Centralizers to be
placed 5' above shoe on joint#1, top of joint #2, and every 2nd joint to 400' above Garden Gulch top.
(15± total). Thread lock float shoe, top and bottom of float collar, and top of 2ndjOinÍ.

6. MUD PROGRAM:

Surface Hole Procedure (0 - 500' ± below GL):

Air/air mist or aerated water

Production Hole Procedure (500' ± - TD):

Anticipated mud weight 9.0 - 9.5 ppg depending on actual wellbore condition
encountered while drilling.

500'± - TD A closed mud system will be utilized. A bentonite gelled water mud system will be used
to control viscosity w/PHPA polymer used for supplemental viscosity and clay
encapsulation/inhibition. Water loss will be maintained at <l5cc's using white starch or
PAC. Bactericides will be used as needed. Anticipated pH will range from 9.0-10.0.
Mud weight will be adjusted as necessary for well control. Deflocculants/thinners will be
used as necessary to maintain mud quality. LCM sweeps will be utilized as necessary to
control lost circulation and mud loss. CO2 contamination, if encountered, will be treated
with lime and gypsum.

7. VARIANCE REQUESTS:

Reference: Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 - Item E: Special Drilling Operations

EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring the blooie line to be 100' in length.
Due to reduce location excavation, the blooie line will be approximately 75' in length

8 point plan-EOG 2
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

BIG SPRING 3-36GR
SWINE, SEC. 36, T10S, R15E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

8. EVALUATION PROGRAM:

Logs: Mud log from base of surface casing to TD.
Open Hole Logs: Open Hole Logs will be run consisting of the following:

Schlumberger Platform Express: Open Hole Gamma Ray, Resistively, and
Neutron Porosity

9. CEMENT PROGRAM:

Surface Hole Procedure (0-500'± Below GL)

Lead: 185 sks Class 'G' cement with 2% S1 (CaCl2) & 0.25 pps
D29 (cellophane flakes), mixed at 15.8 ppg, 1.16 ft3./sk.,4.95 gps water.

Top Out: 207 sks Top out with Class 'G' cement with 2% Sl (CaCl2) in mix water,
15.8 ppg, 1.16
ft3./sk.,4.95 gps via 1" tubing set at 25' if needed.

Install 6' x 4' cellar ring, drill rat and mouse holes with spud rig.

Note: Cement volumes will be calculated to bring cement to surface.

Production Hole Procedure (500' ± to TD)

Lead: 70 sks: 35:65 Poz "G" w/4% D20 (Bentonite), 2% Dl74 (Extender), 0.2% D65
(Dispersant),0.2% D46 (Antifoam), 0.75% Dll2 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.200%
Dl3 (Retarder), 0.25 pps D29 (cello flakes) mixed at 13.0 ppg, 1.75 n3/sk.,9.19
gps water.

Tail: 635 sks: 50:50 Poz "G" w/ 2% D20 (Bentonite), 0.1% D46 (Antifoam), 0.075% Dl3
(Retarder), 0.2% Dl67 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant), mixed at
14.1 ppg, 1.28 n3/sk.,5.9gps water.

Note: The above number of sacks is based on gauge-hole calculation.
Lead volume to be calculated to bring cement to 200'± above 9-5/8" casing shoe.
Tail volume to be calculated to bring cement to 400'± above top of Garden Gulch MBR.

Final Cement volumes will be based upon gauge-hole plus 45% excess.
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

BIG SPRING 3-36GR
SWINE, SEC. 36, T10S, R15E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

10. ABNORMAL CONDITIONS:

Surface Hole (Surface - 500'±):

Lost circulation

Production Hole (500'± - TD):

Sloughing shales, lost circulation and l<eyseat development are possible in the Garden Gulch
Formation.

11. STANDARD REQUIRED EQUIPMENT:

A. Choke Manifold
B. Upper and Lower Kelly Cock
C. Stabbing Valve
D. Visual Mud Monitoring

12. HAZARDOUS CHEMICALS:

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA title III in an amount equal to or greater than
10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in association
with the drilling of this well. Furthermore, no extremely hazardous substances, as defined in 40
CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities, will be used, produced, stored, transported, or
disposed of in association with the drilling of this well.

(Attachment: BOP Schematic Diagram)
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WORKSHEET
AfPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 04/27/2006 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-013-33168

WELL NAME: BIG SPRING 3-36 GR

OPERATOR: EOG RESOURCES INC ( N9550 ) PHONE NUMBER: 435-789-0790

CONTACT: KAYLENE GARDNER

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
SWNE 36 1005 150E .Tech Review Initials Date
SURFACE: 2024 FNL 2030 FEL

BOTTOM: 2024 FNL 2030 FEL Engineering

COUNTY: DUCHESNE
Geology

LATITUDE: 39.90216 LONGITUDE: -110.1777

UTM SURF EASTINGS:570297 NORTHINGS:4417012 Surface

FIELD NAME: WILDCAT ( 1 )

LEASE TYPE: 3 - State

LEASE NUMBER: ML-47051 PROPOSED FORMATION: WSTC

SURFACE OWNER: 3 - State COALBED METHANE WELL? NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

gr^ Plat R649-2-3.

v Bond:Fed[] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[]
Unit: BIG WASH (DEEP)

(No. 6196017 )
Potash (Y/N) \ R649-3-2. General

AÁ Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

/ Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception
(No.49-1501 )

A RDCC Review (Y/N)
Drilling Unit

(Date: Board Cause No:
Eff Date:

AL Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

gik Intent to Commingle (Y/N) .R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS: ¿ pc
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T10S RiSE T10S R16E

BIG SPRING
3-36GRO

HIG WASH DHiP UNIT

TIIS RISE TiiS Ri6E

MIAMI STATE SB-i

OPERATOR: EOG RESOURCES INC (N9550)
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Application for Permit to Drill
Statement of Basis

1/29/2007 Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Page i

APD No API WellNo Status Well Type Surf Ownr CBM
30 43-013-33168-00-00 OW S No
Operator EOG RESOURCES INC Surface Owner-APD
Well Name BIG SPRING 3-36 GR Unit BIG WASH (DEEP)
Field WILDCAT Type of Work
Location SWNE 36 10S 15E S 0 FL 0 FL GPS Coord (UTM) 570297E 4417012N

Geologic Statement of Basis
EOG proposes to set 500 feet of surface casing cemented to the surface. The base of the moderately saline
water is estimated at 4,700 feet. A search of Division of Water Rights records shows no water wells within a
10,000 foot radius of the proposed location. The surface formation at this location is the Uinta Formation. The
Uinta Formation is made up of discontinuous sands interbedded with shales and are not expected to produce
prolific aquifers. The proposed casing and cementing program should adequately protect usable ground water
in the area.

Brad Hill 1/29/2007
APD Evaluator Date / Time

Surface Statement of Basis
General area is the Big Wash drainage approximately 32 road miles southwest of Myton, Ut. Access is by
State, County and oilfield development roads. The area is characterized by ridges and draws which sometimes
become deep with steep side slopes. Big Wash is an ephemeral drainage. Only flows are intermittent occurring
during spring runoff and following intense summer storms. No springs or seeps are known to exist in the area.

The proposed Big Spring 3-36GR well is on the east side of a gentle sloping ridge which slopes north toward
Big Wash. Three small swales begin within the location and will not require diversions.

Both the surface and minerals belong to SITLA. Mr. Jim Davis represented SITLA at the presite investigation.
The location appears to be the best site for drilling and operating a well in the inunediate area.

Ben Williams representing the Utah Division of Wildlit'e Resources stated the area is classified as critical
winter habit for elk and high value winter habitat for deer. He recommended to Jim Davis of SITLA and Byron
Tolman of EOG a winter seasonal activity restriction to reduce the impact of the wintering elk. This season
would be from Dec. 15 to April 15. He recommended no road or pad construction, drilling or use of work-over
rigs during this period. He gave both Mr. Davis and Mr. Tolman copies of his wildlife evaluation and a DWR
recommended seed mix to be used when re-seeding the area.

Floyd Bartlett 1/24/2007
Onsite Evaluator Date / Time

Conditions of Approval / Application for Permit to Drill
Category Condition
Pits A synthetic liner with a minimum thickness of 16 mils with a felt subliner shall be

properly installed and maintained in the reserve
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OTV-SITE PREDRILL EVALUAT10N
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

Operator EOG RESOURCES INC
Well Name BIG SPRING 3-36 GR
API Number 43-013-33168-0 APD No 30 Field/Unit WILDCAT
Location: 1/4,1/4 SWNE Sec 36 Tw 10S Rng 15E 0 FL 0 FL
GPS Coord (UTM) 570298 4417020 Surface Owner

Participants
Floyd Bartlett (DOGM), Byron Tolman and Terry Csere (EOG), Jim Davis (SITLA), Ben Williams (DWR)

Regional/Local Setting & Topography
General area is the Big Wash drainage approximately 32 road miles southwest of Myton, Ut. Access is by State, County
and oilfield development roads. The area is characterized by ridges and draws which sometimes become deep with steep
side slopes. Big Wash is an ephemeral drainage. Only flows are intermittent occurring during spring runoff and following
intense summer storms. No springs or seeps are known to exist in the area.

The proposed Big Spring 3-36GR well is on the east side of a gentle sloping ridge which slopes north toward Big Wash.
Three small swales begin within the location and will not require diversions.

Surface Use Plan
Current Surface Use
Grazing
Wild1fe Habitat

New Road
Miles Well Pad Src Const Material Surface Formation

0.35 Width 261 Length 325 Onsite UNTA

Ancillary Facilities N

Waste Management Plan Adequate? Y

Environmental Parameters
Affected Floodplains and/or Wetland N

Flora / Fauna
Pinyon juniperwith little understory.
Elk, deer, coyotes, rabbits, other small mammals and birds.

Soil Type and Characteristics
Under snow. Expected to be a shallow shaley loam

Erosion Issues N

Sedimentation Issues N

Site Stability Issues N

Drainage Diverson Required N

1/29/2007 Page

OTV-SITE PREDRILL EVALUAT10N
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

Operator EOG RESOURCES INC
Well Name BIG SPRING 3-36 GR
API Number 43-013-33168-0 APD No 30 Field/Unit WILDCAT
Location: 1/4,1/4 SWNE Sec 36 Tw 10S Rng 15E 0 FL 0 FL
GPS Coord (UTM) 570298 4417020 Surface Owner

Participants
Floyd Bartlett (DOGM), Byron Tolman and Terry Csere (EOG), Jim Davis (SITLA), Ben Williams (DWR)

Regional/Local Setting & Topography
General area is the Big Wash drainage approximately 32 road miles southwest of Myton, Ut. Access is by State, County
and oilfield development roads. The area is characterized by ridges and draws which sometimes become deep with steep
side slopes. Big Wash is an ephemeral drainage. Only flows are intermittent occurring during spring runoff and following
intense summer storms. No springs or seeps are known to exist in the area.

The proposed Big Spring 3-36GR well is on the east side of a gentle sloping ridge which slopes north toward Big Wash.
Three small swales begin within the location and will not require diversions.

Surface Use Plan
Current Surface Use
Grazing
Wild1fe Habitat

New Road
Miles Well Pad Src Const Material Surface Formation

0.35 Width 261 Length 325 Onsite UNTA

Ancillary Facilities N

Waste Management Plan Adequate? Y

Environmental Parameters
Affected Floodplains and/or Wetland N

Flora / Fauna
Pinyon juniperwith little understory.
Elk, deer, coyotes, rabbits, other small mammals and birds.

Soil Type and Characteristics
Under snow. Expected to be a shallow shaley loam

Erosion Issues N

Sedimentation Issues N

Site Stability Issues N

Drainage Diverson Required N

1/29/2007 Page



Berm Required? N

Erosion Sedimentation Control Required? N

Paleo Survey Run? Y Paleo Potental Observed? N Cultural Survey Run? Y Cultural Resources?

Reserve Pit

Site-Specific Factors Site Ranking
Distance to Groundwater (feet) >200 0
Distance to Surface Water (feet) >1000 0
Dist. Nearest Municipal Well (ft) >5280 0
Distance to Other Wells (feet) >1320 0
Native Soil Type Mod permeability 10
Fluid Type Fresh Water 5
Drill Cuttings Normal Rock 0
Annual Precipitation (inches) 10 to 20 5
Affected Populations <10 0
Presence Nearby Utility Conduits Not Present 0

Final Score 20 1 Sensitivity Level

Characteristics / Requirements
The reserve pit is proposed in the southwest corner of the location within a area of cut. A 16mil liner with a felt sub-
liner is planned by EOG. Pit size is 75' x 147' x 12' deep

Closed Loop Mud Required? N Liner Required? Y Liner Thickness 16 Pit Underlayment Required? Y

Other Observations / Comments
Ben Williams representing the Utah Division of Wildlife Resources stated the area is classified as critical winter habit for
elk and high value winter habitat for deer. He recommended to Jim Davis of SITLA and Byron Tolman of EOG a winter
seasonal activity restriction to reduce the impact of the wintering elk. This season would be from Dec. 15 to April 15. He
recommended no road or pad construction, drilling or use of work-over rigs during this period. He gave both Mr. Davis and
Mr. Tolman copies of his wildlife evaluation and a DWR recommended seed mix to be used when re-seeding the area.

Floyd Bartlett 1/24/2007
Evaluator Date / Time
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Well name: 2007-02 EOG Big Spring 3-36GR
Operator: EOG Resources Inc.
String type: Surface Project ID:

43-013-33168
Location: Duchesne County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 75 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 82 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 290 ft

Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface

Burs:
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 440 psi
Internal gradient: 0.120 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 500 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 5,600 ft
Tension is based on buoyed weight. Next mud weight: 9.500 ppg
Neutral point: 438 ft Next setting BHP: 2,764 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 500 ft
Injection pressure: 500 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft')
1 500 9.625 36.00 J-55 ST&C 500 500 8.796 216.9

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 218 2020 9.262 500 3520 7.04 16 394 25.01 J

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801-538-5357 Date: February 9,2007
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 500 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of thisdesign wi/Ibe thatof the
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Well name: 2007-02 EOG Big Spring 3-36GR
operator: EOG Resources Inc.
String type: Production Project ID:

43-013-33168
Location: Duchesne County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collaose Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 9.500 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 75 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 153 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,500 ft

Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 2,620 ft

Burst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 1,532 psi
Internal gradient: 0.220 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 2,764 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on buoyed weight.
Neutral point: 4,805 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft')
1 5600 4.5 11.60 J-55 LT&C 5600 5600 3.875 488.7

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 2764 4960 1.795 2764 5350 1.94 56 162 2.91 J

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801-538-5357 Date: February 9,2007
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 5600 ft, a mud weight of 9.5 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of thisdesign will be that of the
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DiangWhitney - Well Clerance Page 1

From: Ed Bonner
To: Whitney, Diana
Date: 6/27/2006 10:17:58 AM
Subject: Well Clerance

The following wells have been given cultural resource clearance by the Trust Lands Cultural Resources
Group:

Dominion E&P, Inc
LCU 1-2H

Enduring Resources, LLC
Rock House 10-23-23-32
Rock House 11-23-11-2

EOG Resources, Inc
Big Spring 3-36 GR
East Chapita 30-16

The Houston Exploration Company
North Horseshoe 1-16-6-21
North Horseshoe 13-16-6-21
North Horseshoe 13-2-6-21
North Horseshoe 15-2-6-21

Kerr McGee Oil&Gas Onshore LP
NBU 921-25A
NBU 921-25P
NBU 921-35J
NBU 922-32K2

Questar Exploration &Production
HR 2MU-2-12-23
HR 3MU-2-12-23
HR 6MU-2-12-23 (Cleared providedoperator follows arch consultants recommendation to move

location avoidingsignificantsite)
HR 10MU-2-12-23
HR 12MU-2-12-23
HR 14MU-2-12-23
HR 16MU-2-12-23

Stone Energy Corporation
Stone Rush 44-32-8-17

Ifyou have any questions regarding thismatter please give me a call.

CC: Davis, Jim; Garrison, LaVonne; Hill,Brad; Hunt,
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JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
Governor

GARY R. HERBERT
%gg, Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah February 14, 2007

Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAEL R. STYLER
Executive Director EOG Resources, Inc.
Division of PO Box 1815

Oil, Gas & Mining Vernal, UT 84078

JOHN R. BAZA
Division Director

Re: Big Spring 3-36 GR Well, 2024' FNL, 2030' FEL, SW NE, Sec. 36,
T. 10 South, R. 15 East, Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-l et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-013-33168.

Sincerely,

Gil Hunt
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Duchesne County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office
SITLA

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340• facsimile (801) 359-3940•TTY (801) 538-7458 •
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Operator: EOG Resources, Inc.

Well Name & Number Big Spring 3-36 GR

API Number: 43-013-33168
Lease: ML-47051

Location: SW NE Sec. 36 T. 10 South R. 15 East

Conditions of Approval
1. General

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following
action during drilling of this well:

• 24 hours prior to cementing or testing casing - contact Dan Jarvis
• 24 hours prior to testing blowout prevention equipment - contact Dan Jarvis
• 24 hours prior to spudding the well - contact Carol Daniels
• Within 24 hours of any emergency changes made to the approved drilling

program - contact Dustin Doucet
• Prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well - contact Dan

Jarvis

The operator is required to get approval from the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining before
performing any of the following actions during the drilling of this well:

• Plugging and abandonment or significant plug back of this well - contact Dustin
Doucet

• Any changes to the approved drilling plan - contact Dustin Doucet

The following are Division of Oil, Gas and Mining contacts and their telephone numbers
(please leave a voice mail message if the person is not available to take the call):

• Dan Jarvis at: (801) 538-5338 office
(801) 733-0983 home

• Carol Daniels at: (801) 538-5284 office
• Dustin Doucet at: (801) 538-5281 office

(801) 733-0983 home

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Prog;ress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational
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4. Compliance with the State of Utah Antiquities Act forbids disturbance of archeological,
historical, or paleontological remains. Should archeological, historical or paleontological
remains be encountered during your operations, you are required to immediately suspend
all operations and immediately inform the Trust Lands Administration and the Division
of State History of the discovery of such remains.

5. Compliance with the Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill outlined in
the Statement of Basis. (Copy Attached)

6. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns)
have not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the
"Board"). In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the
operator is requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to
analyze geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data
from surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its
analysis, and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon
which the well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate
order from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such
analysis by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.

7. Cement volume for the 4 1/2" production string shall be determined from actual hole
diameter in order to place cement from the pipe setting depth back to 300' MD as
indicated in the submitted drilling
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

ML-47051
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to
drill horiZontal laterais. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER

8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

Big Spring 3-36GR
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EOG Resources, Inc. 43-013-33168

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

600 17th St., Suite 1000N Denver CO 80202 (303) 824-5526 Wildcat
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: 2024' FNL & 2030' FEL 39.902203 LAT 110.177633 LON COUNTY: Duchesne

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SWNE 36 10S 15E S STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING O FRACTURE TREAT O SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EOG Resources, Inc. requests permission to change the casing program for the production string for the referenced well from
4-1/2N CSSing to 5-1/2" casing.

A revised drilling plan is attached.

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED BYTHE STATE RECEIVED

(5/2000) on Reverse
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

BIG SPRING 3-36GR
SWINE, SEC. 36, T10S, R15E, S.L.B.&M.

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

1. & 2. ESTIMATED TOPS & ANTICIPATED OIL, GAS, & WATER ZONES:

FORMATION TVD-RKB (ft) Objective Lithology
Uinta FM 12

Green River FM 310
Mahogany Oil Shale Bed 1,656

Garden Gulch MBR 1,711 Secondary Oil / Gas
Middle Carb Bed 2,581

Douglas Creek MBR 3,311 Secondary Oil / Gas
Castle Peak MBR 4,281 Primary Oil / Gas

Uteland Butte MBR 4,616 Primary Oil / Gas
Wasatch 4,787

TD 4,850

EST. TD: 4,850' or 200' ± below Wasatch Top Anticipated BHP: 2,400 Psig

1. Fresh Waters may exist in the upper, approximately 1,000 ft ± of the Green River Formation,
with top at about 2,000 ft ±.

2. Cement isolation is installed to surface of the well isolating all zones by cement.

3. PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT: Production Hole - 5,000 Psig
BOP Schematic Diagram attached.

4. CASING PROGRAM:

Length jSjze WEIGHT Grade Thread R_agng
CASING Size Collapse Burst Twile

Conductor 17 ½" O - 45' 13 ¾" 48.0# H-40 STC 770 PSI 1730 PSI 322,000#

Surface 12 ¼" 0' - 500' KB± 9-¾" 36.0# J-55 STC 2020 PSI 3520 Psi 394,000#
Production 7-7/8" Surface - TD 5-½" 17.0# J-55 LTC 4910 PSI 5320 Psi 247,000#

All casing will be new or inspected.

8 point plan-EOG l
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

BIG SPRING 3-36GR
SW/NE, SEC. 36, T10S, R15E, S.L.B.&M.

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

5. Float Eauiument:

Surface Hole Procedure (0 - 500' ± Below GL):
Guide Shoe
Insert Float Collar (PDC drillable)
Centralizers: 1 - 5-10' above shoe, every collar for next 3 joints (4 total).

Production Hole Procedure (500' ± - TD):

Float shoe, 1 joint casing, float collar and balance of casing to surface. 4-½", l1.6#, J-55 or equivalent
marker collars or short casing joints to be placed 400' above top of Garden Gulch. Centralizers to be
placed 5' above shoe on joint #1, top of joint #2, and every 2nd joint to 400' above Garden Gulch top.
(15± total). Thread lock float shoe, top and bottom of float collar, and top of 2ndJOÎHÍ.

6. MUD PROGRAM:

Surface Hole Procedure (0 - 500' ± below GL):

Air/air mist or aerated water

Production Hole Procedure (500' ± - TD):

Anticipated mud weight 9.0 - 9.5 ppg depending on actual wellbore condition
encountered while drilling.

500'±- TD A closed mud system will be utilized. A bentonite gelled water mud system will be used
to control viscosity w/PHPA polymer used for supplemental viscosity and clay
encapsulation/inhibition. Water loss will be maintained at <l5cc's using white starch or
PAC. Bactericides will be used as needed. Anticipated pH will range from 9.0-10.0.
Mud weight will be adjusted as necessary for well control. Deflocculants/thinners will be
used as necessary to maintain mud quality. LCM sweeps will be utilized as necessary to
control lost circulation and mud loss. CO2 contamination, if encountered, will be treated
with lime and gypsum.

7. VARIANCE REQUESTS:

Reference: Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 - Item E: Special Drilling Operations

EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring the blooie line to be 100' in length.
Due to reduce location excavation, the blooie line will be approximately 75' in length

8 point plan-EOG 2
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

BIG SPRING 3-36GR
SWINE, SEC. 36, T10S, R15E, S.L.B.&M.

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

8. EVALUATION PROGRAM:

Logs: Mud log from base of surface casing to TD.
Open Hole Logs: Open Hole Logs will be run consisting of the following:

Schlumberger Platform Express: Open Hole Gamma Ray, Resistively, and
Neutron Porosity

9. CEMENT PROGRAM:

Surface Hole Procedure (0-500'± Below GL)

Lead: 185 sks Class 'G' cement with 2% Sl (CaCl2) & 0.25 pps
D29 (cellophane flakes), mixed at 15.8 ppg, 1.16 ft3./sk., 4.95 gps water.

Top Out: 207 sks Top out with Class 'G' cement with 2% S1 (CaCl2) in mix water,
15.8 ppg, 1.16
ft3./sk., 4.95 gps via 1" tubing set at 25' if needed.

Install 6' x 4' cellar ring, drill rat and mouse holes with spud rig.

Note: Cement volumes will be calculated to bring cement to surface.

Production Hole Procedure (500' ± to TD)

Lead: 68 sks: 35:65 Poz "G" w/4% D20 (Bentonite), 2% Dl74 (Extender), 0.2% D65
(Dispersant),0.2% D46 (Antifoam), 0.75% Dll2 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.200%
Dl3 (Retarder), 0.25 pps D29 (cello flakes) mixed at 13.0 ppg, 1.75 ft*/sk., 9.19
gps water.

Tail: 568 sks: 50:50 Poz "G" w/ 2% D20 (Bentonite), 0.1% D46 (Antifoam), 0.075% Dl3
(Retarder), 0.2% Dl67 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant), mixed at
14.1 ppg, 1.28 ft'/sk., 5.9gps water.

Note: The above number of sacks is based on gauge-hole calculation.
Lead volume to be calculated to bring cement to 200'± above 9-5/8" casing shoe.
Tail volume to be calculated to bring cement to 400'± above top of Garden Gulch MBR.

Final Cement volumes will be based upon gauge-hole plus 45% excess.
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

BIG SPRING 3-36GR
SW/NE, SEC. 36, T10S, R15E, S.L.B.&M.

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

10. ABNORMAL CONDITIONS:

Surface Hole (Surface - 500'±):

Lost circulation

Production Hole (500'± - TD):

Sloughing shales, lost circulation and key seat development are possible in the Garden Gulch
Formation.

11. STANDARD REQUIRED EQUIPMENT:

A. Choke Manifold
B. Upper and Lower Kelly Cock
C. Stabbing Valve
D. Visual Mud Monitoring

12. HAZARDOUS CHEMICALS:

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA title III in an amount equal to or greater than
10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in association
with the drilling of this well. Furthermore, no extremely hazardous substances, as defined in 40
CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities, will be used, produced, stored, transported, or
disposed of in association with the drilling of this well.

(Attachment: BOP Schematic Diagram)
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2007-02 EOG Big Spring 3-36GRrev.
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Well name: 2007-02 EOG Big Spring 3-36GRrev.
Operator: EOG Resources Inc.
String type: Production Project ID:

43-013-33168
Location: Duchesne County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? NoMud weight: 9.500 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 75 °F

Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 153 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,500 ft

Burst:
factor 1.00 Cement top: 2,337 ft

Max anticipated sudace
pressure: 1,532 psi

Internal gradient: 0.220 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 2,764 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on buoyed weight.
Neutral point: 4,793 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft3)
1 5600 5.5 17.00 J-55 LT&C 5600 5600 4.767 730.9

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 2764 4910 1.777 2764 5320 1.93 « 81 247 3.03 J

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801-538-5357 Date: June 18,2007
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, UtahRemarks:

Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 5600 ft, a mud weight of 9.5 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design willbe that of the
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Neutral point: 4,793 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft3)
1 5600 5.5 17.00 J-55 LT&C 5600 5600 4.767 730.9

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 2764 4910 1.777 2764 5320 1.93 « 81 247 3.03 J

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801-538-5357 Date: June 18,2007
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 5600 ft, a mud weight of 9.5 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design willbe that of the



STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-47051

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existingwells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL 2 OTHER Big Spring 3-36GR
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

EOG Resources, Inc. 43-013-33168
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WLDCAT:

1060 East Highway 40 Vernal STATE UT ZiP 84078 (435) 781-9111 Wildcat
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 2024' FNL & 2030' FEL 39.902203 LAT 110.177633 LON COUNTY DUchesne

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SWNE 36 10S 15E S STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests permission to change the drilling plan for the referenced well as follows:

1. & 2. Formations - Mahogany Oil Shale is a secondary objective
5. Float Equipment/prod. hole - balance of casing to surface..." was 4 1/2" 11.6#, changed to 5 1/2" 17#
5. Float equipment/prod. hole - marker jointto be 400' above Douglas Creek, NOT Garden Gulch
5. Float equipment/prod. hole -

...every 2nd jointto 400' above Mahogany Oil Shale, NOT Garden Gulch
8. Evaluation/OH logs - Dipole Sonic logs will be run in addition to Schlumberger Platform Express: Open Hole Gamma Ray,
Resistively, and Neutron Porosity
9. Cement/Prod - Lead cement changed to 11.0 ppg, from 13.0ppg
9. Cement/notes - Tail vol. calculated to 400#' above the Mahogany Oil Shale, NOT Garden Gulch.

A revised drilling plan is attached.

NAME(PLEASE PRI ) Kpyleng R. Gardner TlTLE Sr. Regulatory Assistant

SIGNAT D I DATE 6/22/2007

(This space for ate e only)

OF UTAH D VISION OF
OIL, GA', A MINING ECEIVED

DATE: JUN2 52007
(5/2000)

95 00A /

ns on ReversLSid
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

BIG SPRING 3-36GR
SW/NE, SEC. 36, T10S, R15E, S.L.B.&M.

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

1. & 2. ESTIMATED TOPS & ANTICIPATED OIL, GAS, & WATER ZONES:

FORIMIATION TVD-RKB(ft) Objective Lithology
Uinta FM surface

Green River FM 310
Mahogany Oil Shale Bed 1,656 Secondary Oil

Garden Gulch MBR 1,711 Secondary Oil / Gas
Middle Carb Bed 2,581

Douglas Creek MBR 3,311 Secondary Oil / Gas
Castle Peak MBR 4,281 Primary Oil / Gas

Uteland Butte MBR 4,616 Secondary Oil/ Gas
Wasatch 4,787

TD 4,850

EST. TD: 4,850' or 200' ± below Wasatch Top Anticipated BHP: 2,395 Psig

1. Fresh Waters may exist in the upper, approximately 1,000 ft ± of the Green River Formation,
with top at about 2,000 ft ±.

2. Cement isolation is installed to surface of the well isolating all zones by cement.

3. PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT: Production Hole - 5,000 Psig
BOP Schematic Diagram attached.

4. CASING PROGRAM:

CASING Hole Length Size WEIGHT Grade Thread Rating Factor
Size Collapse Burst Tensile

Conductor 17 ½" 0 - 45' 13 ¾" 48.0# H-40 STC 770 PSI 1730 PSI 322,000#
Surface 12 ¼" 0'-- 500' KB± 9-%" 36.0# J-55 STC 2020 PSI 3520 Psi 394,000#

Production 7-7/8" Surface - TD 5-½" 17.0# J-55 LTC 4910 PSI 5320 Psi 247,000#

All casing will be new or inspected.

8 point plan-EOG l
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

BIG SPRING 3-36GR
SWINE, SEC. 36, T10S, R15E, S.L.B.&M.

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

5. Float Eauioment:

Surface Hole Procedure (0 - 500' ± Below GL):
Guide Shoe
Insert Float Collar (PDC drillable)
Centralizers: 1 - 5-10' above shoe, every collar for next 3 joints(4 total).

Production Hole Procedure (500' ± - TD):

Float shoe, 1 joint casing, float collar and balance of casing to surface. 5½", 17.0#, J-55 or equivalent
marker collars or short casing jointsto be placed 400' above top of Douglas Creek. Centralizers to be
placed 5' above shoe on joint#1, top of joint#2, and every 2nd joint to 400' above Mahogany Oil Shale.
(15± total). Thread lock float shoe, top and bottom of float collar, and top of 2ndjOinÍ.

6. MUD PROGRAM:

Surface Hole Procedure (0 - 500' ± below GL):

Air/air mist or aerated water

Production Hole Procedure (500' ± - TD):

Anticipated mud weight 9.0 - 9.5 ppg depending on actual wellbore condition
encountered while drilling.

500'± - TD A closed mud system will be utilized. A bentonite gelled water mud system will be used
to control viscosity w/PHPA polymer used for supplemental viscosity and clay
encapsulation/inhibition. Water loss will be maintained at <15cc's using white starch or
PAC. Bactericides will be used as needed. Anticipated pH will range from 9.0-10.0.
Mud weight will be adjusted as necessary for well control. Deflocculants/thinners will be
used as necessary to maintain mud quality. LCM sweeps will be utilized as necessary to
control lost circulation and mud loss. CO2 contamination, if encountered, will be treated
with lime and gypsum.

7. VARIANCE REQUESTS:

Reference: Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 - Item E: Special Drilling Operations

EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring the blooie line to be 100' in length.
Due to reduce location excavation, the blooie line will be approximately 75' in length

8 point plan-EOG 2
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

BIG SPRING 3-36GR
SWINE, SEC. 36, T10S, R15E, S.L.B.&M.

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

8. EVALUATION PROGRAM:

Logs: Mud log from base of surface casing to TD.
Open Hole Logs: Open Hole Logs will be run consisting of the following:

Schlumberger - Platform Express & DSI: Open Hole Gamma Ray,
Resistivity, Neutron Porosity, Dipole Sonic

9. CEMENT PROGRAM:

Surface Hole Procedure (0-500'± Below GL)

Lead: 185 sks Class 'G' cement with 2% S1 (CaCl2) & 0.25 pps
D29 (cellophane flakes), mixed at 15.8 ppg, 1.16 ft3./sk.,4.95 gps water.

Top Out: 207 sks Top out with Class 'G' cement with 2% Sl (CaCl2) in mix water,
15.8 ppg, 1.16
ft3./sk.,4.95 gps via 1" tubing set at 25' if needed.

Install 6' x 4' cellar ring, drill rat and mouse holes with spud rig.

Note: Cement volumes will be calculated to bring cement to surface.

Production Hole Procedure (500' ± to TD)

Lead: 55 sks: Hi-Lift "G" + 12% D20 (Bentonite) + 1% D79 (Extender) + 0.25% Dll2 (Fluid
Loss) + 0.2% D46 (Anti-foamer) + 5% D44 (Accelerator) + 0.125 pps Dl30
(LCM) mixed at 11.0 ppg, 3.98 ft3/sk, 25.25 gps water

Tail: 485 sks: 50:50 Poz "G" w/ 2% D20 (Bentonite), 0.1% D46 (Antifoam), 0.075% D13
(Retarder), 0.2% Dl67 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant), mixed at
14.1 ppg, 1.28 ft3/sk., 5.9gps water

Note: The above number of sacks is based on gauge-hole calculation.
Lead volume to be calculated to bring cement to 200'± above 9-5/8" casing shoe.
Tail volume to be calculated to bring cement to 400'± above top of Mahogany Oil Shale.

Final Cement volumes will be based upon gauge-hole plus 45% excess.
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

BIG SPRING 3-36GR
SWINE, SEC. 36, T10S, R15E, S.L.B.&M.

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

10. ABNORMAL CONDITIONS:

Surface Hole (Surface - 500'±):

Lost circulation

Production Hole (500'± - TD):

Sloughing shales, lost circulation and key seat development are possible in the Garden Gulch
Formation.

11. STANDARD REQUIRED EQUIPMENT:

A. Choke Manifold
B. Upper and Lower Kelly Cock
C. Stabbing Valve
D. Visual Mud Monitoring

12. HAZARDOUS CHEMICALS:

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA title III in an amount equal to or greater than
10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in association
with the drilling of this well. Furthermore, no extremely hazardous substances, as defined in 40
CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities, will be used, produced, stored, transported, or
disposed of in association with the drilling of this well.

(Attachment: BOP Schematic Diagram)
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DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: EOG Resources, Inc

Well Name: Big Spring 3-36 GR

API No: 43-013-33168 Lease Type: State

Section 36 Township 10S Range 15E County Duchesne

Drilling Contractor Rocky Mountain Drilling Rig # Rathole

SPUDDED:
Date 6-28-07

Time 2:30 PM

How Dry

Drilling will Commence:

Reported by Jerry Barnes

Telephone # 435-828-1720

Date 7-3-07 Signed
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-47051

6 IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7 UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLfonn for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8 WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Big Spring 3-36GR

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR 9. API NUMBER:

EOG Resources, Inc. 43-013-33168
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

600 17th St., Suite 1000N Denver CO 80202 (303) 262-2812 Exploratory
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 2,024' FNL &2,030' FEL 39.902203 LAT110.177633 LON COUNTY DUchesne

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SWNE 36 10S 15E S.L.B. & M. STATE:
UTAH

« CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

2 SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion:
COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Well spud
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

The referenced well spud on 6/28/2007.

siAMEA(PULEASEP Ma TE 2era2tionsClerk

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

OlV.OFOIL,GAS&
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOFNATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-47051

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IFINDIAN.ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for suchproposals.

L TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER
OIL WELL GAS WELL 2 OTHER Big Spring 3-36GR

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR 9. API NUMBER:

EOG Resources, Inc. 43-013-33168

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

600 17th St., Suite 1000N ,
Denver sT rE CO ZIP 80202 (303) 262-2812 Exploratory

4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 2,024' FNL &2,030' FEL 39.902203 LAT110.177633 LON COUNTY: Duchesne

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SWNE 36 10S 15E S.L.B. &M. STATE:
UTAH

a CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT O CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL

(Submit Original Form Only)
O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion
COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

EOG Resources, Inc. requests authorization for disposal of produced water from the referenced well to any of the following
locations.

1. Natural Buttes Unit 21-208 SWD
2. Chapita Wells Unit 550-30N SWD
3. Ace Disposal
4. RN Industries

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

NAME(PLEASE PR T) Carrie MacDonald TITLE Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE 6/29/2007

(This space for State use only)

RECElVED

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
JULO32007

DN.0F0\L,GAS&

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOFNATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-47051

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IFINDIAN.ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for suchproposals.

L TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER
OIL WELL GAS WELL 2 OTHER Big Spring 3-36GR

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR 9. API NUMBER:

EOG Resources, Inc. 43-013-33168

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

600 17th St., Suite 1000N ,
Denver sT rE CO ZIP 80202 (303) 262-2812 Exploratory

4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 2,024' FNL &2,030' FEL 39.902203 LAT110.177633 LON COUNTY: Duchesne

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SWNE 36 10S 15E S.L.B. &M. STATE:
UTAH

a CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT O CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL

(Submit Original Form Only)
O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion
COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

EOG Resources, Inc. requests authorization for disposal of produced water from the referenced well to any of the following
locations.

1. Natural Buttes Unit 21-208 SWD
2. Chapita Wells Unit 550-30N SWD
3. Ace Disposal
4. RN Industries

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

NAME(PLEASE PR T) Carrie MacDonald TITLE Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE 6/29/2007

(This space for State use only)

RECElVED

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
JULO32007

DN.0F0\L,GAS&



STATEOFUTAH FORM6
DEPARTMENTOFNATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator: EOG RESOURCES, INC· Operator Account Number: N 9550

Address: 600 17th Street

city Denver

state CO zip 80202 Phone Number: (303) 262-2812

Well 1

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
43-013-33168 BIG SPRING 3-36GR SWNE 36 10S 15E DUCHESNE

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

A 99999 6/28/2007 pg
Comments:

Well 2
API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

43-047-38599 CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 1224-11 NWNW 11 9S 22E UINTAH

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number EffectiveDate

A 99999 (p ) 6/27/2007

Comments:

Well 3
API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

ACTION CODES:
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) Carrie MacDonald

B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unit well) Na (Please Print

C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity Jignature

E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) RECENEIÀperationsClerk 6/29/2007

(5/2000)
JULO3 2W

itle Date

DKOF0\L,GAS&

STATEOFUTAH FORM6
DEPARTMENTOFNATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator: EOG RESOURCES, INC· Operator Account Number: N 9550

Address: 600 17th Street

city Denver

state CO zip 80202 Phone Number: (303) 262-2812

Well 1

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
43-013-33168 BIG SPRING 3-36GR SWNE 36 10S 15E DUCHESNE

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

A 99999 6/28/2007 pg
Comments:

Well 2

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

43-047-38599 CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 1224-11 NWNW 11 9S 22E UINTAH

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number EffectiveDate

A 99999 (p ) 6/27/2007

Comments:

Well 3
API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

ACTION CODES:
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) Carrie MacDonald

B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unit well) Na (Please Print

C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity

D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity Jignature

E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) RECENEIÀperationsClerk 6/29/2007

(5/2000)
JULO3 2W

itle Date

DKOF0\L,GAS&



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

ML-47051

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use thisform for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL -- 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL U OTHER Big Spring 3-36GR

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EOG Resources, Inc. 43-013-33168

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

600 17th St., Suite 1000N Denver STATE CO zio80202 (303) 824-5526 Exploratory
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: 2024' FNL &2030' FEL 39.902203 LAT110.177633 LON COUNTY: Duchesne

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SWNE 36 10S 15E S.L.B. & M. STATE:
UTAH

ii. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ^CIDIZE DEEPEN O REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) O ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT O SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR O NEW CONSTRUCTION O TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS O OPERATOR CHANGE O TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING O PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT Q CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion:
O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The referenced well was turned to sales on 10/9/2007. Please see the attached operations summary report for drilling and
completion operations performed on the subject well.

RECEIVED
OCT17 2007

DEOFOIL,GAS&MINING

NA EP Ma . Ma ta DATE RGOU5latory Assistant

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

ML-47051

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use thisform for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL -- 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL U OTHER Big Spring 3-36GR

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EOG Resources, Inc. 43-013-33168

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

600 17th St., Suite 1000N Denver STATE CO zio80202 (303) 824-5526 Exploratory
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: 2024' FNL &2030' FEL 39.902203 LAT110.177633 LON COUNTY: Duchesne

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SWNE 36 10S 15E S.L.B. & M. STATE:
UTAH

ii. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ^CIDIZE DEEPEN O REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) O ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT O SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR O NEW CONSTRUCTION O TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS O OPERATOR CHANGE O TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING O PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT Q CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion:
O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The referenced well was turned to sales on 10/9/2007. Please see the attached operations summary report for drilling and
completion operations performed on the subject well.

RECEIVED
OCT17 2007

DEOFOIL,GAS&MINING

NA EP Ma . Ma ta DATE RGOU5latory Assistant

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse



WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT

Report Generated On: 10-15-2007

Well Name BIG SPRING03-36GR WellType EXPO Division DENVER

Field PETE'S WASH SHALLOW API g 43-013-33168 Well Class 15A

County, State DUCilESNE, UT Spud Date 07-16-2007 Class Date 10-09-2007

Thx Credit N TVD / MD 4,850/ 4,850 Property # 055134

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 0-0 Shoe TVD / MD 0/ 0

KB / GL Elev 6,773/ 6,760

Location Section36, T105, RISE, SWNE, 2024 FNL & 2030 FEL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL& COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCES,INC WI % 100.0 NRI % 82.5

AFE No 302883 AFE Total 961,700 DHC / CWC 478,200/ 483,500

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #27 Start Date 04-25-2006 Release Date 07-17-2007

04-25-2006 Reported By SHARONWHITLOCK

DailyCosts: DrBung 50 Completion $0 DaByTotal $0

Cum Costs: DrBHng 50 Completion $0 Well Total 50

MD 0 TVD 0 Pmgress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATIONDATA

2024' FNL & 2030' FEL (SWINE)

SECTION36, T10S, R15E

DUCHESNECOUNH UTAH

LAT39.902203, LONG 110.177633(NAD 27)

RIG:TRUE27

OBJECTIVE: 4850' TD, UTELANDBUTTEMBR

WC/GAS

BIG SPRINGPROSPECT

DD&A:

NATURALBUTTESFIELD

LEASE: ML-47051

ELEVATION:6763.8' NATGL, 6760.4' PREP GL (DUETO ROUNDINGTHE PREP GL IS 6760'), 6773' KB (13')

EOG BPOWI 100%, NRI 82.50%

06-19-2007 Reported By TERRYCSERE

DailyCosts: DrHling $38,000 Completion $0 Daily Total

WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT

Report Generated On: 10-15-2007

Well Name BIG SPRING03-36GR WellType EXPO Division DENVER

Field PETE'S WASH SHALLOW API g 43-013-33168 Well Class 15A

County, State DUCilESNE, UT Spud Date 07-16-2007 Class Date 10-09-2007

Thx Credit N TVD / MD 4,850/ 4,850 Property # 055134

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 0-0 Shoe TVD / MD 0/ 0

KB / GL Elev 6,773/ 6,760

Location Section36, T105, RISE, SWNE, 2024 FNL & 2030 FEL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL& COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCES,INC WI % 100.0 NRI % 82.5

AFE No 302883 AFE Total 961,700 DHC / CWC 478,200/ 483,500

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #27 Start Date 04-25-2006 Release Date 07-17-2007

04-25-2006 Reported By SHARONWHITLOCK

DailyCosts: DrBung 50 Completion $0 DaByTotal $0

Cum Costs: DrBHng 50 Completion $0 Well Total 50

MD 0 TVD 0 Pmgress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATIONDATA

2024' FNL & 2030' FEL (SWINE)

SECTION36, T10S, R15E

DUCHESNECOUNH UTAH

LAT39.902203, LONG 110.177633(NAD 27)

RIG:TRUE27

OBJECTIVE: 4850' TD, UTELANDBUTTEMBR

WC/GAS

BIG SPRINGPROSPECT

DD&A:

NATURALBUTTESFIELD

LEASE: ML-47051

ELEVATION:6763.8' NATGL, 6760.4' PREP GL (DUETO ROUNDINGTHE PREP GL IS 6760'), 6773' KB (13')

EOG BPOWI 100%, NRI 82.50%

06-19-2007 Reported By TERRYCSERE

DailyCosts: DrHling $38,000 Completion $0 Daily Total



Well Name: BIG SPRING 03-36GR Field: PETE'S WASHSHALLOW Property: 055134

Cum Costs: DriHing 538,000 Compledon 50 WellTotal $38,000

MD 0 TVD 0 Pmgress 0 Days 0 MW 0 0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILDLOCAIlON

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATIONSTARTED.

0 20-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: DriHing 50 Compledon $0 DaHy Total $0

Cum Costs: Druling $38,000 Completion $0 Weß Total $38,000

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hra Activity Descripdon
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATIONIS 40% COMPLETE.

06-21-20&T Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: DrHling 50 Compledon $0 Daily Total $0
Cum Costs: DrBHng 538,000 Compledon $0 Wen Total $38,000

MD 0 TVD 0 Pmgress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formadon : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILDLOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION 50% COMPLETE.

06-22-2007 Reported By TERRYCSERE

DanyCosts: DriHing $0 Compledon 50 DaByTotal $0
Cum Costs: DriHing $38,000 Completion $0 WeH Total 538,000

MD 0 TVD 0 Pmgress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILDLOCATION

Start End Hrs Acdvity Descripdon
06:00 06:00 24.0 ROCKEDOUT.

06-25-2007 Reported By TERRYCSERE

DailyCosts: DrilHng 50 Completion 50 Daily Total 50

Cum Costs: DrBHng 538,000 Completion $0 WeHTotal $38,000

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 SHOOTINGTODAY.

06-26-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Page

Well Name: BIG SPRING 03-36GR Field: PETE'S WASHSHALLOW Property: 055134

Cum Costs: DriHing 538,000 Compledon 50 WellTotal $38,000

MD 0 TVD 0 Pmgress 0 Days 0 MW 0 0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILDLOCAIlON

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATIONSTARTED.

0 20-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: DriHing 50 Compledon $0 DaHy Total $0

Cum Costs: Druling $38,000 Completion $0 Weß Total $38,000

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hra Activity Descripdon
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATIONIS 40% COMPLETE.

06-21-20&T Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: DrHling 50 Compledon $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: DrBHng 538,000 Compledon $0 Wen Total $38,000

MD 0 TVD 0 Pmgress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formadon : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILDLOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION 50% COMPLETE.

06-22-2007 Reported By TERRYCSERE

DanyCosts: DriHing $0 Compledon 50 DaByTotal $0
Cum Costs: DriHing $38,000 Completion $0 WeH Total 538,000

MD 0 TVD 0 Pmgress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILDLOCATION

Start End Hrs Acdvity Descripdon

06:00 06:00 24.0 ROCKEDOUT.

06-25-2007 Reported By TERRYCSERE

DailyCosts: DrilHng 50 Completion 50 Daily Total 50

Cum Costs: DrBHng 538,000 Completion $0 WeHTotal $38,000

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SHOOTINGTODAY.

06-26-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Page



WellName: BIG SPRING03-36GR Field: PETE'S WASHSHALLOW Property:055134

Cum Costs: Drilling $38,000 Completion $0 WellTotal $38,000

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Acdvity at Report Time: BUILDLOCATION

Start End Hrs Acdvity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 PUSHINGOUT PIT.

06-27-2007 Reported By TERRYCSERE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 DaHyTotal $0

Cum Costs: DrBHng $38,000 Completion $0 Weß Total $38,000

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formadon : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Acdvity at Report Time: BUILDLOCATION

Start End Hrs Acdvity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LINE THURSDAY MORNING.

06-29-2007 Reported By KAYLENEGARDNER

DailyCosts: DrBung 50 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: DrBHng $38,000 Completion $0 WeH Total $38,000

MD o TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Acdvity at Report Time: WOAIR RIG

Start End Hrs Acdvity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION COMPLETE.ROCKYMOUNTAIN DRILLINGSPUDA 20" HOLE ON 6/28/2007 @ 2:30 PM. SET 40' OF

14" CONDUCTOR.CEMENTTO SURFACEWITH READYMIX.JERRYBARNESNGITFIEDRACHEALMEDINA
W/UDOGMOF THE SPUD 6/28/2007 @ 1:30 PM.

07-04-2007 Reported By JERRYBARNES

DauyCosts: DrBHng $71,288 Compledon $0 Daily Total 571,288

Cum Costs: DrBHng $109,288 Compledon $0 Well Total $109,288

MD 527 TVD 527 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formadon : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Acdvity at Report Time: WORI'

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRUCRAIG'S AIR RIG #3 ON 6/29/1067. DRIO FD 12-1/4" HOLE TO 540' GL. ENCOUNTEREDNO WATER.

RAN 12JTS (514.48') OF 9-5/8", 36.0#,J-55, ST&C CASINGWITH DAVIS/LYNCHGUIDE SHOE AND FLOAT
COLLAR. 4 CENTRALIZERSSPACEDMIDDLE OF SHOE JOINTAND EVERYCOLLAR TILL GONE. LANDED @
527' KB. RDMO AIR RIG.

MIRUPROPETROCEMENTING.HELD SAFETY MEETING.PRESSURETESTEDLINESAND CEMENTVALVE
10 1000 PSIG. PUMPED30 BBLS FRESHWATER& 20 BBLSGFu Fn WATERFLUSHAHEADOF CEMENT.
MIXED& PUMPED 250 SX (51.2 BBLS)OF PREMIUM CEMENT Wl2% CACL2& ¼ #/SX FLOCELE. MIXED
CEMENT @ 15.8 PPG W/YIELDOF 1.15 CF/SX.

DISPLACED CEMENTWl36.5 BBLS FRESHWATER.BUMPEDPLUG W/500# @ 9:17 AM, 6/30/2007.CHECKED
FLOAT,FLOATDID NGT HOLD.PRESSUREUP CASING & SHUT-IN CASINGVALVE.BROKECIRCULATION
4.5 BBLS INTOCEMENT.CIRCULATED10BBLSOF CEMENTTO PIT. HOLE STOODFULL WHEN PLUG
BUMPED.

Page

WellName: BIG SPRING03-36GR Field: PETE'S WASHSHALLOW Property:055134

Cum Costs: Drilling $38,000 Completion $0 WellTotal $38,000

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Acdvity at Report Time: BUILDLOCATION

Start End Hrs Acdvity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 PUSHINGOUT PIT.

06-27-2007 Reported By TERRYCSERE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 DaHyTotal $0

Cum Costs: DrBHng $38,000 Completion $0 Weß Total $38,000

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formadon : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Acdvity at Report Time: BUILDLOCATION

Start End Hrs Acdvity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LINE THURSDAY MORNING.

06-29-2007 Reported By KAYLENEGARDNER

DailyCosts: DrBung 50 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: DrBHng $38,000 Completion $0 WeH Total $38,000

MD o TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Acdvity at Report Time: WOAIR RIG

Start End Hrs Acdvity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION COMPLETE.ROCKYMOUNTAIN DRILLINGSPUDA 20" HOLE ON 6/28/2007 @ 2:30 PM. SET 40' OF

14" CONDUCTOR.CEMENTTO SURFACEWITH READYMIX.JERRYBARNESNGITFIEDRACHEALMEDINA
W/UDOGMOF THE SPUD 6/28/2007 @ 1:30 PM.

07-04-2007 Reported By JERRYBARNES

DauyCosts: DrBHng $71,288 Compledon $0 Daily Total 571,288

Cum Costs: DrBHng $109,288 Compledon $0 Well Total $109,288

MD 527 TVD 527 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formadon : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Acdvity at Report Time: WORI'

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRUCRAIG'S AIR RIG #3 ON 6/29/1067. DRIO FD 12-1/4" HOLE TO 540' GL. ENCOUNTEREDNO WATER.

RAN 12JTS (514.48') OF 9-5/8", 36.0#,J-55, ST&C CASINGWITH DAVIS/LYNCHGUIDE SHOE AND FLOAT
COLLAR. 4 CENTRALIZERSSPACEDMIDDLE OF SHOE JOINTAND EVERYCOLLAR TILL GONE. LANDED @
527' KB. RDMO AIR RIG.

MIRUPROPETROCEMENTING.HELD SAFETY MEETING.PRESSURETESTEDLINESAND CEMENTVALVE
10 1000 PSIG. PUMPED30 BBLS FRESHWATER& 20 BBLSGFu Fn WATERFLUSHAHEADOF CEMENT.
MIXED& PUMPED 250 SX (51.2 BBLS)OF PREMIUM CEMENT Wl2% CACL2& ¼ #/SX FLOCELE. MIXED
CEMENT @ 15.8 PPG W/YIELDOF 1.15 CF/SX.

DISPLACED CEMENTWl36.5 BBLS FRESHWATER.BUMPEDPLUG W/500# @ 9:17 AM, 6/30/2007.CHECKED
FLOAT,FLOATDID NGT HOLD.PRESSUREUP CASING & SHUT-IN CASINGVALVE.BROKECIRCULATION
4.5 BBLS INTOCEMENT.CIRCULATED10BBLSOF CEMENTTO PIT. HOLE STOODFULL WHEN PLUG
BUMPED.
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Well Name:BIG SPRING03-36GR Field: PETE'S WASHSHALLOW Property: 055134

PREPAREDLOCATION FOR RGI'ARYRIG.WORI' WILL DROPFROM REPORTUNTILFURTHERACTIVITY.

NO SURVEY@THIS TIME.

LESTER FARNSWORTHNGITFIEDDAVEHACKFORDWlUDOGMOF THE SURFACECASING & CEMENTJOB
ON 6/29/2007 @ 8:00AM.

07-15-2007 Reported By PAULWHITE

DailyCosts: DrBHng $19,372 Completion $0 Daily Total $19,372

Cum Costs: DrBHng $128,660 Completion $0 WeRTotal $128,660

MD 527 TVD 527 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RURT

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 RIG DOWNRUTARYTOOLS.

07:00 13:30 6.5 RIG DOWN W/ TRUCKS.

13:30 16:30 3.0 LOAD OUT AND MOVERIG W/ TRUCKS.

16:30 18:00 1.5 RIG UP W/ TRUCKS.NO ACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS.

SAFETYMEETINGW/ RWJONES. FULL CREW.

SUBBASESET AND SPREADERSINSTALLED.TRUCKS SCHEDULEDFOR07:00 TO CONTINUERIG UP.

07-1 2007 Reported By PAULWHITE

DailyCosts: Druling 547,267 Completion $4,915 Daily Total $52,182

Cum Costs: Drilling $175,927 Completion $4,915 Well Total $180,842

MD 950 TVD 950 Progress 423 Days 1 MW 8.3 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 11:00 5.0 RIG UP W/ RW JONES,TRUCKS RELEASEDAT 11:00 HRS.

11:00 16:00 5.0 RIG UP,RAISE DERRICKAT 14:00 HRS. FILL WATERTANKSAND PITSW/ WATER.

16:00 18:00 2.0 ACCEFI' RIG ON DAYWORKAT 16:00 HRS 7/15/07. NIPPLE UP BOP'S. PREPARETO TEST.

18:00 22:00 4.0 TEST BOP'S W/ B&CQUICKTEST UPPERAND LOWER KELLYVALVE, INSIDE BOP, SAFETYVALVE, PIPE
RAMSAND INSIDEVALVES,PIPE RAMSAND OUTSIDEVALVES(HCR),OUTSIDECHECK VALVE,
CHOKELINE,ALL CHOKE MANIFOLDVALVESAND SURFACECASING.ALL TESTS 250 LOWAND 5000 HIGH.
ANNULAR 250/2500.CASINGTEST 1500 PSIl30 MIN. ALL TESTS GOOD, NO LEAKS.

CALLED MICHAEL LEE AND JAMIE SPARGERW/ VERNALBLMAND DANJARVISW/ UDOGMAND
INFORMEDTHEM OF INTENTIONTO SPUD ANDTEST BOP'S. CALLS MADEAT 0830 7/15/07.

22:00 22:30 0.5 INSTALLWEAR BUSHING.

22:30 00:00 1.5 PICKUP BHA.

00:00 00:30 0.5 SERVICERIG.

00:30 02:00 1.5 DRILL CEMENT/FLOAT EQUIP.

02:00 02:30 0.5 RUN FORMATION INTEGRITY TEST TO 12.1 PPG EMW.

02:30 03:00 0.5 REPLACEVALVE SPRINGIN #2 PUMP

03:00 06:00 3.0 DRILLFI 527TO 950. 423' 141FPH. DRLG.WI WATER.NOACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS.SAFETY MEETING
TOPICS:PU BHA, NIPPLINGUP BOP'S. FULL CREW.CHECKCOM. BOPTEST.
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Well Name:BIG SPRING03-36GR Field: PETE'S WASHSHALLOW Property: 055134

PREPAREDLOCATION FOR RGI'ARYRIG.WORI' WILL DROPFROM REPORTUNTILFURTHERACTIVITY.

NO SURVEY@THIS TIME.

LESTER FARNSWORTHNGITFIEDDAVEHACKFORDWlUDOGMOF THE SURFACECASING & CEMENTJOB
ON 6/29/2007 @ 8:00AM.

07-15-2007 Reported By PAULWHITE

DailyCosts: DrBHng $19,372 Completion $0 Daily Total $19,372

Cum Costs: DrBHng $128,660 Completion $0 WeRTotal $128,660

MD 527 TVD 527 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RURT

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 RIG DOWNRUTARYTOOLS.

07:00 13:30 6.5 RIG DOWN W/ TRUCKS.

13:30 16:30 3.0 LOAD OUT AND MOVERIG W/ TRUCKS.

16:30 18:00 1.5 RIG UP W/ TRUCKS.NO ACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS.

SAFETYMEETINGW/ RWJONES. FULL CREW.

SUBBASESET AND SPREADERSINSTALLED.TRUCKS SCHEDULEDFOR07:00 TO CONTINUERIG UP.

07-1 2007 Reported By PAULWHITE

DailyCosts: Druling 547,267 Completion $4,915 Daily Total $52,182

Cum Costs: Drilling $175,927 Completion $4,915 Well Total $180,842

MD 950 TVD 950 Progress 423 Days 1 MW 8.3 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 11:00 5.0 RIG UP W/ RW JONES,TRUCKS RELEASEDAT 11:00 HRS.

11:00 16:00 5.0 RIG UP,RAISE DERRICKAT 14:00 HRS. FILL WATERTANKSAND PITSW/ WATER.

16:00 18:00 2.0 ACCEFI' RIG ON DAYWORKAT 16:00 HRS 7/15/07. NIPPLE UP BOP'S. PREPARETO TEST.

18:00 22:00 4.0 TEST BOP'S W/ B&CQUICKTEST UPPERAND LOWER KELLYVALVE, INSIDE BOP, SAFETYVALVE, PIPE
RAMSAND INSIDEVALVES,PIPE RAMSAND OUTSIDEVALVES(HCR),OUTSIDECHECK VALVE,
CHOKELINE,ALL CHOKE MANIFOLDVALVESAND SURFACECASING.ALL TESTS 250 LOWAND 5000 HIGH.
ANNULAR 250/2500.CASINGTEST 1500 PSIl30 MIN. ALL TESTS GOOD, NO LEAKS.

CALLED MICHAEL LEE AND JAMIE SPARGERW/ VERNALBLMAND DANJARVISW/ UDOGMAND
INFORMEDTHEM OF INTENTIONTO SPUD ANDTEST BOP'S. CALLS MADEAT 0830 7/15/07.

22:00 22:30 0.5 INSTALLWEAR BUSHING.

22:30 00:00 1.5 PICKUP BHA.

00:00 00:30 0.5 SERVICERIG.

00:30 02:00 1.5 DRILL CEMENT/FLOAT EQUIP.

02:00 02:30 0.5 RUN FORMATION INTEGRITY TEST TO 12.1 PPG EMW.

02:30 03:00 0.5 REPLACEVALVE SPRINGIN #2 PUMP

03:00 06:00 3.0 DRILLFI 527TO 950. 423' 141FPH. DRLG.WI WATER.NOACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS.SAFETY MEETING
TOPICS:PU BHA, NIPPLINGUP BOP'S. FULL CREW.CHECKCOM. BOPTEST.
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WellName:BIG SPRING03-36GR Field: PETE'S WASHSHALLOW Property:055134

FUEL ON HAND 6000 RECEIVED4500 USED 650.

07-17-2007 Reported By PAULWHITE

DailyCosts: Drilling $39,742 Completion $3,164 DaHyTotal $42,906

Cum Costs: DriHing $215,669 Completion $8,079 WellTotal $223,748

MD 4,185 TVD 4.185 Progress 3,235 Days 2 MW 8.7 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:30 0.5 DRILL FI950' TO 1008'.

06:30 07:00 0.5 SURVEYAT930 1 DEG.

07:00 12:30 5.5 DRILL F/ 1008'ID 1978 970' 176FPH. WOB 20 RPM 66.

12:30 13:00 0.5 SERVICERIG.

13:00 20:30 7.5 DRILL FI 1978TO 3038 1060' 141FPH.WOB 25 RPM 70. GPM 420, MMRPM67.

20:30 21:00 0.5 SURVEYAT2952 2.5 DEG.

21:00 06:00 9.0 DRILLF/ 3038 TO 4185 2147'238 FPH.WOB 25 RPM 65, GPM 420, MMRPM67, MUD WT 8.7 VIS 27. STARTED
MIXINGGEL AND POLYTO INCREASEVIS AND PACFOR WATERLOSSCONTROLAT04:00.
SCHLUMBERGER SCHEDULEDFOR 0900 ARRIVAL.TOP DOUGLASCREEK 3351. PROGTOP OF CASTLE
PEAK 4281.

NO ACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS.FULL CREW.SAFETYMEETINGTOPICS:WIRELINE SURVEYS,FACTORSTO
BE CONSIDEREDWHEN MAKEINGFAST HOLE. WORKINGON PUMPS.FUEL ON HAND 4937 USED l197.
CHECK COM. BOP DRILL l 1/2MIN AMAS.

07-18-2007 Reported By PAULWHITE

DailyCosts: DrBung $179,021 Completion $7.396 Dany Total $186,417

Cum Costs: DrBHng $394,690 Completion $15,475 WeRIbtal $410,165

MD 4,980 TVD 4,980 Progress 795 Days 3 MW 8.8 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RIH

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL F/ 4185 TO 4860, TD AT l 100HRS.7/17/07.

I1:00 11:30 0.5 CBU AND RIG SERVICE.

11:30 13:00 1.5 10STANDSHORI'TRIP.WIPEDOUT SOMETIGHT SPOTS.CLEAN RIH. 3' OF FILL.

13:00 13:30 0.5 CHANGE SHAKERSCREENSTO 165'S.

13:30 15:00 1.5 DRILL ADDITIONAL HOLETO TOP OF WASATCH AND MAKE 120' OF RATHOLEFOR IDGGING ANDTO FIT
CASING.FINALTD 4980',

15:00 18:00 3.0 TRIP OUT FOR LOGS, HOLE IN GOOD CONDITION.DROPSURVEY

18:00 20:00 2.0 RIG UP SCHLUMBERGER, HOLD SAFETYMEETING.STAKI' IN HOLE AT 2000 HRS.

20:00 03:00 7.0 SCHLUMBERGER RAN PEX + BHC + ECS FROM 4975' TO 9 5/8 CASING SHOEAT527'.

03:00 04:30 1.5 LAYDOWN LOGGINGTOOLSAND RIG DOWN SCHLUMBERGER.

04:30 06:00 1.5 TRIP IN HOLETO CIRCULXIE FOR CASING.NO ACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS.SAFETY MEETINGTOPICS:
LOCK OUT TAGOUT, MEETINGW/ LOGGERS, WORKINGON PUMPS.FULL CREW. BOP DRILL l 1/2 MIN.
AMAS,CHECK COM. MUDWT. 9.1 VIS 36. FUEL ON HAND4144 USED793.

07-19-2007 Reported By PAUL WHITE

DailyCosts: DrBHug $40,315 Completion $84,949 Daily Total $125,264

Cum Costs: Drilling $435,006 Completion $100,424 WellTotal $535.430
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WellName:BIG SPRING03-36GR Field: PETE'S WASHSHALLOW Property:055134

FUEL ON HAND 6000 RECEIVED4500 USED 650.

07-17-2007 Reported By PAULWHITE

DailyCosts: Drilling $39,742 Completion $3,164 DaHyTotal $42,906

Cum Costs: DriHing $215,669 Completion $8,079 WellTotal $223,748

MD 4,185 TVD 4.185 Progress 3,235 Days 2 MW 8.7 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:30 0.5 DRILL FI950' TO 1008'.

06:30 07:00 0.5 SURVEYAT930 1 DEG.

07:00 12:30 5.5 DRILL F/ 1008'ID 1978 970' 176FPH. WOB 20 RPM 66.

12:30 13:00 0.5 SERVICERIG.

13:00 20:30 7.5 DRILL FI 1978TO 3038 1060' 141FPH.WOB 25 RPM 70. GPM 420, MMRPM67.

20:30 21:00 0.5 SURVEYAT2952 2.5 DEG.

21:00 06:00 9.0 DRILLF/ 3038 TO 4185 2147'238 FPH.WOB 25 RPM 65, GPM 420, MMRPM67, MUD WT 8.7 VIS 27. STARTED
MIXINGGEL AND POLYTO INCREASEVIS AND PACFOR WATERLOSSCONTROLAT04:00.
SCHLUMBERGER SCHEDULEDFOR 0900 ARRIVAL.TOP DOUGLASCREEK 3351. PROGTOP OF CASTLE
PEAK 4281.

NO ACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS.FULL CREW.SAFETYMEETINGTOPICS:WIRELINE SURVEYS,FACTORSTO
BE CONSIDEREDWHEN MAKEINGFAST HOLE. WORKINGON PUMPS.FUEL ON HAND 4937 USED l197.
CHECK COM. BOP DRILL l 1/2MIN AMAS.

07-18-2007 Reported By PAULWHITE

DailyCosts: DrBung $179,021 Completion $7.396 Dany Total $186,417

Cum Costs: DrBHng $394,690 Completion $15,475 WeRIbtal $410,165

MD 4,980 TVD 4,980 Progress 795 Days 3 MW 8.8 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RIH

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL F/ 4185 TO 4860, TD AT l 100HRS.7/17/07.

I1:00 11:30 0.5 CBU AND RIG SERVICE.

11:30 13:00 1.5 10STANDSHORI'TRIP.WIPEDOUT SOMETIGHT SPOTS.CLEAN RIH. 3' OF FILL.

13:00 13:30 0.5 CHANGE SHAKERSCREENSTO 165'S.

13:30 15:00 1.5 DRILL ADDITIONAL HOLETO TOP OF WASATCH AND MAKE 120' OF RATHOLEFOR IDGGING ANDTO FIT
CASING.FINALTD 4980',

15:00 18:00 3.0 TRIP OUT FOR LOGS, HOLE IN GOOD CONDITION.DROPSURVEY

18:00 20:00 2.0 RIG UP SCHLUMBERGER, HOLD SAFETYMEETING.STAKI' IN HOLE AT 2000 HRS.

20:00 03:00 7.0 SCHLUMBERGER RAN PEX + BHC + ECS FROM 4975' TO 9 5/8 CASING SHOEAT527'.

03:00 04:30 1.5 LAYDOWN LOGGINGTOOLSAND RIG DOWN SCHLUMBERGER.

04:30 06:00 1.5 TRIP IN HOLETO CIRCULXIE FOR CASING.NO ACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS.SAFETY MEETINGTOPICS:
LOCK OUT TAGOUT, MEETINGW/ LOGGERS, WORKINGON PUMPS.FULL CREW. BOP DRILL l 1/2 MIN.
AMAS,CHECK COM. MUDWT. 9.1 VIS 36. FUEL ON HAND4144 USED793.

07-19-2007 Reported By PAUL WHITE

DailyCosts: DrBHug $40,315 Completion $84,949 Daily Total $125,264

Cum Costs: Drilling $435,006 Completion $100,424 WellTotal $535.430
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Well Name:BIG SPRING03-36GR Field: PETE'S WASHSHALLOW Property:055134

MD 4,980 TVD 4,980 Progress 0 Days 4 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RDRT/WOCOMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:30 0.5 WASH/REAM4944 TO 4980.

06:30 09:00 2.5 CIRCULATEFOR CASING, RIG UP LAYDOWNCREW, HOLD SAFETY MEETING,RIG SERVICE.

09:00 12:30 3.5 LAYDOWNDRILLPIPE, BHA, BREAKKELLY,PULL WEAR BUSHING.

12:30 17:00 4.5 RUCASING CREW, HOLD SAFETYMEEITNG,RUN 120JTS 5.5" CASING.TAGBUITOM AT4983' CASING
MEASUREMENTS.MAKE UP CASINGHANGER.

17:00 19:00 2.0 CIRCULATEAND RIG UP SCHLUMBERGER.

19:00 20:30 1.5 CEMENTING, SCHLUMBERMIXEDAND PUMPEDCEMENTAS FOLLOWS: 20 BBLSCHEMWASH,20 BBLS
WATER,55.7 BBLS LEAD SLURRY,"G" SLURRYWT. 11PPG. (80 SX). FOLLOWEDWI 137.8BBLS.TAIL
SLURRY, 50/50 POZ "G" SLURRY WT. 14.1 PPG. (600 SX), DISPLACEDW/ 114 BBLS.WATER.BUMPEDPLUG W/

2,500 PSI, CHECKEDFLOATSOK. LANDED 120JTS. 5.5" 17 # J 55 CASING EQUIPEDW/ DAVISLYNCHAUTO
FILL FLOATSHOEAND FLOATCOLLARAND LATCHDOWN WIPER PLUG. CENTRILIZERSPLACED5' ABOVE
SHOE,ON'IX)POF SECONDJOINT AND EVERYOTHERJOINT APTER FOR A TGI'ALOF 30. SHOEAT4965'

FLOATCOLLARAT4921'. MARKERJT AT 3063'. TESTED HANGER SEALSTO 5,000 PSI, CEMENTIN PLAŒ
AT20:30 HRS. 7/18/06

20:30 22:00 1.5 NIPPLEDOWN BOP,CLEAN MUD TANKS.

22:00 06:00 8.0 RIG DOWN AND PREPARERIG FOR TRUCKS. NO ACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS.SAFETYMEETINGSHELDWI
ALLTHIRD PARTYCONTRACTCREWS.FULL CREW.

TRANSFERED 10 JTS OF 5.5" 17#1-55 CASING, 2 MARKERJTS (SAME) AND 1571GAL OF DIESELFUEL TO
PETESWASH 13-4)6GR.

TRUCKSSCHEDULED FOR 07:00 7/19/07.

RIG MOVE TO PETES WASH 13-06GR 15 MILES.

06:00 18.0 RIG RELEASEDAT 22:00 HRS. 7/18/07.

CASINGPOINT COSI': $435,006

07-24-2007 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: DrBHng 50 Compledon $26,992 Dany Total $26,992

Cum Costs: DrBHng $435,006 Completion $127,416 WeB1btal 5562,422

MD 4,980 TVD 4,980 Progress 0 Days 5 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 4921.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP FOR FRACS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
24.0 MIRUSCHLUMBERGER.LOG WITH RSTICBUCCUVDUGR FROM PBTD TO 280'. EST CEMENT TOP @ 550'.

RD SCHLUMBERGER.

07-29-2007 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: DrBHng $0 Completion $1,200 Daily Total $1,200

Cum Costs: DrüHng $435,006 Completion $128,616 WeHTotal $563,622

MD 4,980 TVD 4,980 Progress 0 Days 6 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 4921.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP FOR FRACS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
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Well Name:BIG SPRING03-36GR Field: PETE'S WASHSHALLOW Property:055134

MD 4,980 TVD 4,980 Progress 0 Days 4 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RDRT/WOCOMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:30 0.5 WASH/REAM4944 TO 4980.

06:30 09:00 2.5 CIRCULATEFOR CASING, RIG UP LAYDOWNCREW, HOLD SAFETY MEETING,RIG SERVICE.

09:00 12:30 3.5 LAYDOWNDRILLPIPE, BHA, BREAKKELLY,PULL WEAR BUSHING.

12:30 17:00 4.5 RUCASING CREW, HOLD SAFETYMEEITNG,RUN 120JTS 5.5" CASING.TAGBUITOM AT4983' CASING
MEASUREMENTS.MAKE UP CASINGHANGER.

17:00 19:00 2.0 CIRCULATEAND RIG UP SCHLUMBERGER.

19:00 20:30 1.5 CEMENTING, SCHLUMBERMIXEDAND PUMPEDCEMENTAS FOLLOWS: 20 BBLSCHEMWASH,20 BBLS
WATER,55.7 BBLS LEAD SLURRY,"G" SLURRYWT. 11PPG. (80 SX). FOLLOWEDWI 137.8BBLS.TAIL
SLURRY, 50/50 POZ "G" SLURRY WT. 14.1 PPG. (600 SX), DISPLACEDW/ 114 BBLS.WATER.BUMPEDPLUG W/

2,500 PSI, CHECKEDFLOATSOK. LANDED 120JTS. 5.5" 17 # J 55 CASING EQUIPEDW/ DAVISLYNCHAUTO
FILL FLOATSHOEAND FLOATCOLLARAND LATCHDOWN WIPER PLUG. CENTRILIZERSPLACED5' ABOVE
SHOE,ON'IX)POF SECONDJOINT AND EVERYOTHERJOINT APTER FOR A TGI'ALOF 30. SHOEAT4965'

FLOATCOLLARAT4921'. MARKERJT AT 3063'. TESTED HANGER SEALSTO 5,000 PSI, CEMENTIN PLAŒ
AT20:30 HRS. 7/18/06

20:30 22:00 1.5 NIPPLEDOWN BOP,CLEAN MUD TANKS.

22:00 06:00 8.0 RIG DOWN AND PREPARERIG FOR TRUCKS. NO ACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS.SAFETYMEETINGSHELDWI
ALLTHIRD PARTYCONTRACTCREWS.FULL CREW.

TRANSFERED 10 JTS OF 5.5" 17#1-55 CASING, 2 MARKERJTS (SAME) AND 1571GAL OF DIESELFUEL TO
PETESWASH 13-4)6GR.

TRUCKSSCHEDULED FOR 07:00 7/19/07.

RIG MOVE TO PETES WASH 13-06GR 15 MILES.

06:00 18.0 RIG RELEASEDAT 22:00 HRS. 7/18/07.

CASINGPOINT COSI': $435,006

07-24-2007 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: DrBHng 50 Compledon $26,992 Dany Total $26,992

Cum Costs: DrBHng $435,006 Completion $127,416 WeB1btal 5562,422

MD 4,980 TVD 4,980 Progress 0 Days 5 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 4921.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP FOR FRACS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
24.0 MIRUSCHLUMBERGER.LOG WITH RSTICBUCCUVDUGR FROM PBTD TO 280'. EST CEMENT TOP @ 550'.

RD SCHLUMBERGER.

07-29-2007 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: DrBHng $0 Completion $1,200 Daily Total $1,200

Cum Costs: DrüHng $435,006 Completion $128,616 WeHTotal $563,622

MD 4,980 TVD 4,980 Progress 0 Days 6 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 4921.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP FOR FRACS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
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Well Name:BIG SPRING03-36GR Field: PETE'S WASHSHALLOW Property:055134

24.0 NU SM BOPE. RUWSS. PRESURETEST CASING & BOPE10 4500 PSIG. HELDOK. BLEEDOFF PRESSURE.RD
WSS. PREP FOR FRACS.

08-03-2007 Reported By HOOLEY

DailyCosts: DriBing $46,696 Completion $67,342 Daily Total $114,038

Cum Costs: Drilling $481,703 Completion $195,958 WeUTotal $677,661

MD 4,980 TVD 4,980 Progress 0 Days 5 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : UTELAND BUTTE PBTD : 4963.0 Perf : 4668-4836 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP TO MIRUSU

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP OPSIG. RU CUTTERSWIRELINE.PERFORATEDUTELANDBUTI'E FROM4835-36', 4825-26', 4788-90',
4784-85', 4775-76', 4749-50', 4719-20', 4710-12', 4707-08', 4684-85', 4675-76' AND 4668-49' @ 3 SPF & 120°

PHASING. RDWL.RU SCHLUMBERGER.FRAC DOWN CASINGWITH 250 GAL 7-l/2% HCL,4159 GAL
YF120ST+PAD,40235 GALYF120ST+WITH 142000#20/40 SAND @ 1-8 PPG. MTP 2642 PSIG. MTR 27.9 BPM.
ATP2179 PSIG.ATR26.7 BPM. ISIP 2350 PSIG. RDMOSCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED8 HRS. 32/64"TO OPEN CHOKE.WELL DIED.RECOVERED728 BF.TRACEOF OIL. 438 BLWTR.LEFT
OPEN OVERNIGHT.NO FLOW. SI. WO RIG.

08-09-2007 Reported By HAL IVIE

DailyCosts: DriHing $1,500 Completion $2,275 DaHyTotal $3,775

Cum Costs: DrBHng $483,203 Completion $198,233 Wen Total $681,436

MD 4,980 TVD 4,980 Progress 0 Days 6 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : UTELANDBUTTE PBTD : 4963.0 Perf : 4668-4836 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PICK UP TBG, C-O WELL

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 ROAD RIG & EQUIPMENT F/ GILSONITEDRAW # 11-02

RIG UP RIG. SDFD.

08-10-2007 Reported By HAL IVIE

DailyCosts: Drilling $1,500 Completion $14,489 DaHy Total $15,989

Cum Costs: DrBHng $484,703 Completion $212,722 WeHTotal $691,425

MD 4,980 TVD 4,980 Progress 0 Days 7 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : UTELANDBUTTE PBTD : 4963.0 Perf : 4668-4836 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SWABBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 18:00 12.0 SICP OPSIG. RIH W/BIT & PUMP OFF BIT SUBTO TAG @ 4862'. CLEANEDOUT TO 4918'. RUBBER& FLOAT

COLLAR SHAVINGSIN RETURNS.POH. RIH W/PRODUCITON STRING. LANDED TUBING @4876' KB. SDFN.

TUBING DETAIL LENGTH

NGICHED COLLAR 0.40'

SN 1.10'

157 JTS 2-7/8" 6.5# J-55 TBG 4861.92'

BELOWKB 13.00'

LANDED @ 4876.42'
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Well Name:BIG SPRING03-36GR Field: PETE'S WASHSHALLOW Property:055134

24.0 NU SM BOPE. RUWSS. PRESURETEST CASING & BOPE10 4500 PSIG. HELDOK. BLEEDOFF PRESSURE.RD
WSS. PREP FOR FRACS.

08-03-2007 Reported By HOOLEY

DailyCosts: DriBing $46,696 Completion $67,342 Daily Total $114,038

Cum Costs: Drilling $481,703 Completion $195,958 WeUTotal $677,661

MD 4,980 TVD 4,980 Progress 0 Days 5 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : UTELAND BUTTE PBTD : 4963.0 Perf : 4668-4836 PKR Depth : 0.0
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Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 ROAD RIG & EQUIPMENT F/ GILSONITEDRAW # 11-02

RIG UP RIG. SDFD.

08-10-2007 Reported By HAL IVIE

DailyCosts: Drilling $1,500 Completion $14,489 DaHy Total $15,989

Cum Costs: DrBHng $484,703 Completion $212,722 WeHTotal $691,425

MD 4,980 TVD 4,980 Progress 0 Days 7 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : UTELANDBUTTE PBTD : 4963.0 Perf : 4668-4836 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SWABBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 18:00 12.0 SICP OPSIG. RIH W/BIT & PUMP OFF BIT SUBTO TAG @ 4862'. CLEANEDOUT TO 4918'. RUBBER& FLOAT

COLLAR SHAVINGSIN RETURNS.POH. RIH W/PRODUCITON STRING. LANDED TUBING @4876' KB. SDFN.

TUBING DETAIL LENGTH

NGICHED COLLAR 0.40'

SN 1.10'

157 JTS 2-7/8" 6.5# J-55 TBG 4861.92'

BELOWKB 13.00'

LANDED @ 4876.42'
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Well Name: BIG SPRING 03-36GR Field: PETE'S WASHSHALLOW Property:055134

08-11-2007 Reported By HAL IVŒ

DailyCosts: Drilling $1,500 Completion $5,602 Daily Total $7,102

Cum Costs: Druling $486,203 Completion $218,324 WeHTotal $704,527

MD 4,980 TVD 4,980 Progress 0 Days 8 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : UTELAND BUTTE PBTD : 4963.0 Perf : 4668--4836 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SWABBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 17:00 11.0 SICP & SITP 0 PSIG. STARTSWABBING:IFL @ 100', MADE 43 RUNS.RECOVERED269 BBLTOTALFLUID,O
BBLS,WATER269 BBL. PULLINGFROM 3900' TO SN @ 4874.92'. LASl' 16 RUNS,FFL @ 3900', BLWTR900 BBL,
EST 20-25 BPH FLUID ENTRY.RD SWABEQUIPMENT.SWI. SDFD.

08-14-2007 Reported By HAL IVIE

DailyCosts: DrBHug $1,500 Completion $35,354 Daily Total $36,854

Cum Costs: DrBUng $487,703 Completion $253,678 WeHTotal $741,381

MD 4,980 TVD 4,980 Progress 0 Days 9 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : UTELANDBUTTE PBTD : 4963.0 Perf : 4668-4836 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RDMOSU,WAITON SWABRIG

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 17:00 11.0 SICP 550 PSIG, SITP OPSIG. RU SWAB EQUIPMENT.IFL @2600'. MADE 4 RUNS.REC 34 BBLTGl'AL FLUID,0

OIL, 34 BBLWTR , FFL @ 3200', BLTR, 866 BBI'S. RD SWAB EQUIPMENT,SWI. RDMOSU,WAITON SWAB
UNIT.

08-19-2007 Reported By SEARLE

DauyCosts: DrilUng $1,500 Completion $35,354 Daily Total $36,854

Cum Costs: DrHling $489,203 Completion $289,032 WeH Total $778,235

MD 4,980 TVD 4,980 Progress 0 Days 10 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : UTELANDBUTTE PBTD : 4963.0 Perf : 4668-4836 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SWABTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
07:00 16:00 9.0 MIRU SWAB UNIT. SITP 50 PSIG. SICP 800PSIG. MADE 11RUNS.IFL 2400'. RECOVERED82 BBL. EST 30%OIL

CUT FFL 3900'. FLOWED 15 MIN AFTER LAST RUN. BLWTR 809. SWIFN.

08-22-2007 Reported By HAL IVIE

DailyCosts: DrBUng $1,500 Completion $8,562 Daily Total $10,062

Cum Costs: DriHing $490,703 Completion $297394 Weu Total $788,297

MD 4,980 TVD 4,980 Progress 0 Days 10 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : UTELAND BUTTE PBTD : 4918.0 Perf : 4668-4836 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RIH WIPUMP& RODS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 17:00 11.0 MIRUSU.SITP 200 PSIG. SICP 550 PSIG. BLEWWELL DOWN.PUMPED40 BBLS TREATED FW DOWN TBG. ND

WH. NU BOP.POH. RIH WIPRODUCTIONSTRING.ND BOP.LANDEDTBG @ 4880' KB Wl10 K TENSION.NU
WH. SDFN.

TUBING DETAIL LENGTH

NOTCHED COLLAR .40'
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MD 4,980 TVD 4,980 Progress 0 Days 10 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : UTELAND BUTTE PBTD : 4918.0 Perf : 4668-4836 PKR Depth : 0.0
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TUBING DETAIL LENGTH

NOTCHED COLLAR .40'

Page



Well Name:BIG SPRING03-36GR Field: PETE'S WASHSHALLOW Property: 055134

SN 1.10'

I3 JTS 2-7/8"6.5# 1-55 TBG 404.46'
5-1/2" TAC(447 l') 2.72'

144 JTS 2-7/8" 6.5# J-55 TBG 4457.46'

BELOWKB 13.00'

STRETCH l.00'

LANDED @ 4880.14' KB

08-23-2007 Reported By HAL IVIE

DanyCosts: Druling $1,500 Completion $17,679 Daily Total $19,179

Cum Costs: DrBHng $492,203 Completion $315,273 WellTotal 5807,476

MD 4,980 TVD 4,980 Progress 0 Days 11 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : UTELANDBITTTE PBTD : 4918.0 Perf : 4668-4836 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WO FACILITIES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 12:00 6.0 SITP & SICP 0 PSIG. RIH WlPUMP & RODS.SEATED& SPACEDPUMP.TESTEDTO 500 PSIG. HYDRAULICED

TO 500 PSIG. SI. RDMOSU.WO FACILITIES.

ROD DETAIL

2-1/2" X 1-1/2" X 12' X 15' X 16', RHBC, 118" STROKE,WEATHERFORDPUMP #2154

4 1-1/2" K-BARS

123 3/4" D RODS

66 7/8" D RODS
1 7/8" X 6' PONY ROD

l 1-1/4" X 26' POL ROD

1 7/8" X 2' PONY ROD

FINALCOMPLETION DATE: 8/22/07

10-12-2007 Reported By DUANE COOK

DanyCosts: DrBHng 50 Completion 50 Dany Total 50

Cum Costs: DrBHng $492,203 Completion $315,273 Wen Total $807.476

MD 4,980 TVD 4,980 Progress 0 Days 12 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : UTELANDBUTTE PBTD : 4918.0 Perf : 4668-4836 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: INITIALCONDENSATEPRODUCTION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 INITIALPRODUCTION.TURNED CONDENSATE'ID SALES 10/9/07.OPENINGPRESSURE:TP O& CP 40 PSI, 7

SPM. TURNED WELL TO QUESTARSALESAT 8:00AM, 10/9/07.

PUMPED 27 BO & 57 BW IN 24 HRS, SICP 100 PSIG, 8 X 86" SPM X L.

10-15-2007 Reported By ROGER DART

Daily Costs: DriHing $1 500 Completion $17,679 Daily Total $19,179

Cum Costs: DriHing $493,703 Completion $332,952 WeH Total $826,655

MD 4,980 TVD 4,980 Progress 0 Days 13 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
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Well Name: BIG SPRING 03-36GR Field: PETE'S WASHSHALLOW Property:055134

Formation : UTELANDBUTTE PBTD : 4918.0 Perf : 4668-4836 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 10/13/07 PUMPED60 BO & 12 BW IN 24 HRS, SICP 110PSIG, 8 X 86" SPM X L.

10/14/07 PUMPED0 BO & 0 BW IN 24 HRS, SICP 110PSIG, 8 X 86" SPM X L. UNIT DOWN,BACKON.

10/15/07 PUMPED0 BO & 33 BW IN 24 HRS, SICP 120PSIG, 8 X 86" SPM X L. BACKON.
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STATE OF UTAH AMENDED REPORT FORM 8
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES (highlight changes)

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-47051

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

1a. TYPE OF WELL: LLL ESLL DRY OTHER
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
NE

L
HORZ. DNEEP- -TRY FSFVR.

OTHER Big Spring 3-36GR
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EOG Resources, Inc. 43-013-33168
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT

600 17th St., Suite 1000N ciTY Denver STATE CO zie 80229 (303) 824-5526 Exploratory
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

MERIDIAN:
ATSURFACE: 2024' FNL & 2030' FEL 39.902203 LAT 110.177633 LON SWNE 36 10S 15E S
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVALREPORTED BELOW: Same

12. COUNTY 13. STATE
AT TOTAL DEPTH: Same Duchesne UTAH

14. DATE SPUDDED: 15. DATE T.D. REACHED: 16. DATECOMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL):

6/28/2007 7/17/2007 10/9/2007 ABANDONED READYTOPRODUCE O 6764' NATGL
18. TOTAL DEPTH: MD 4,980 19. PLUG BACKT.D.: MD 4,918 20. IF MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS, HOW MANYT* 21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD

PLUG SET:
TVD TVD TVD

22. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICALLOGS RUN (Submit copy of each) 23.

WAS WELL CORED? NO YES (Submit analysis)( RSTICBL/CCUVDL/GR
\ WAS DST RUN7 NO YES (Submit report)

DIRECTIONALSURVEY7 NO YES (Submit copy)

24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in well)

HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE WEIGHT (#/ft.) TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) STAGEDCEMENTER CNEMEONF
S

KES
VO

UœM
BBL) CEMENT TOP ** AMOUNT PULLED

12-1/4" 9-5/8 J-55 36.0 0 527 250 sx
7-7/8" 5-1/2 J-55 17.0 0 4,965 680 sx

25. TUBING RECORD

SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

2-7/8 4.880
26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD

FORMATIONNAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM(TVD) INTERVAL(Top/Bot - MD) SIZE NO. HOLES PERFORATION STATUS

(A) Green River 4,668 4,836 4,668 4,836 3/sof open so-o

(B) Open Sqwd

(C) Open Squeezed

(D) Open Squeezed

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNT AND TYPE OF MATERIAL

4668-4836 250 GALS HCL; 44,394 GALS GELLED WATER & 142,000# 20/40 SAND

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

ELECTRICAL/MECHANICALLOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONALSURVEY Producing
SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGING AND CEMENT VERIFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER:

RECEIVID
(5/2000) (CONTINUEDON BACK) DECO6 2007

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&
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DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



31. INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVALA (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:

10/9/2007 10/12/2007 24 RATES: * 60 0 12 Flows
CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:

110 RATES: 60 0 12 Producing
INTERVALB (As shown in Item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES:

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. PI GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES:

INTERVALC (As shown in Item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES:

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. PI GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES:

INTERVALD (As shown In Item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:

RATES:

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. PI GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES:

32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

33. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION (Log) MARKERS:

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Formation o o m Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (Measu
edp

Depth)

Green River 4,668 4,836 Wasatch 4.837
U. Garden Gulch 2.420
U. Doualas Creek 3.367

35. ADDITIONAL REMARKS (include plugging procedure)

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached Information is complete and correct as determined from all available records.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Mary A. Maestas TITLE Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE 12/4/2007

This report must be submi ed within 30 days of
e completing or plugging a new well e reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
• drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore • significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
e recompleting to a different producing formation • drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from twoor more formations.

** ITEM24: Cement Top-Show how reported top(s)of cement were determined (circulated (CIR),calculated (CAL),cement bond log (CBL),temperaturesurvey (TS)).

Send to: Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

31. INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVALA (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:

10/9/2007 10/12/2007 24 RATES: * 60 0 12 Flows
CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:

110 RATES: 60 0 12 Producing
INTERVALB (As shown in Item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES:

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. PI GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES:

INTERVALC (As shown in Item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES:

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. PI GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES:

INTERVALD (As shown In Item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:

RATES:

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. PI GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES:

32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

33. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION (Log) MARKERS:

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Formation o o m Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (Measu
edp

Depth)

Green River 4,668 4,836 Wasatch 4.837
U. Garden Gulch 2.420
U. Doualas Creek 3.367

35. ADDITIONAL REMARKS (include plugging procedure)

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached Information is complete and correct as determined from all available records.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Mary A. Maestas TITLE Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE 12/4/2007

This report must be submi ed within 30 days of
e completing or plugging a new well e reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
• drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore • significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
e recompleting to a different producing formation • drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from twoor more formations.

** ITEM24: Cement Top-Show how reported top(s)of cement were determined (circulated (CIR),calculated (CAL),cement bond log (CBL),temperaturesurvey (TS)).

Send to: Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801



Big Spring 3-36GR -ADDITIONAL REMARKS(CONTINUED):

Perforated the Uteland Butte from 4668-4669', 4675-4676', 4684-4685', 4707-4708', 4710-
4712', 4719-4720', 4749-4750', 4775-4776', 4784-4785', 4788-4790', 4825-4826' & 4835-
4836' w/ 3

Big Spring 3-36GR -ADDITIONAL REMARKS(CONTINUED):

Perforated the Uteland Butte from 4668-4669', 4675-4676', 4684-4685', 4707-4708', 4710-
4712', 4719-4720', 4749-4750', 4775-4776', 4784-4785', 4788-4790', 4825-4826' & 4835-
4836' w/ 3



STATE OF UTAH FORM 7
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

REPORT OF WATER ENCOUNTERED DURING DRILLING

Well name and number: BIG SPRING 3-36

API number: 4301333168

Well Location: QQ SWNE Section 36 Township 10S Range 15E County DUCHESNE

Well operator: EOG

Address: 1060 E HWY40

city VERNAL state UT zip 84078 Phone: (435) 781-9111

Drillingcontractor: CRAIGS ROUSTABOUT SERVICE

Address: PO BOX 41

city JENSEN state UT z¡p 84035 Phone: (435) 781-1367

Water encountered (attach additional pages as needed):

DEPTH VOLUME QUALITY
FROM TO (FLOW RATE OR HEAD) (FRESH OR SALTY)

NO WATER

Formation tops: 1 2 3
(Top to Bottom)

4 5 6

7 8 9

10 11 12

Ifan analysis has been made of the water encountered, please attach a copy of the report to thisform.

I hereby certify that this report is true and complete to the best of my knowledge.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) 8 - SGS SS
.

SIGNATUR

2egula0toryAssistant

STATE OF UTAH FORM 7
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

REPORT OF WATER ENCOUNTERED DURING DRILLING

Well name and number: BIG SPRING 3-36

API number: 4301333168

Well Location: QQ SWNE Section 36 Township 10S Range 15E County DUCHESNE

Well operator: EOG

Address: 1060 E HWY40

city VERNAL state UT zip 84078 Phone: (435) 781-9111

Drillingcontractor: CRAIGS ROUSTABOUT SERVICE

Address: PO BOX 41

city JENSEN state UT z¡p 84035 Phone: (435) 781-1367

Water encountered (attach additional pages as needed):

DEPTH VOLUME QUALITY
FROM TO (FLOW RATE OR HEAD) (FRESH OR SALTY)

NO WATER

Formation tops: 1 2 3
(Top to Bottom)

4 5 6

7 8 9

10 11 12

Ifan analysis has been made of the water encountered, please attach a copy of the report to thisform.

I hereby certify that this report is true and complete to the best of my knowledge.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) 8 - SGS SS
.

SIGNATUR

2egula0toryAssistant



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-47051

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnewwells, significantly deepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Big Spring 3-36GR

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

EOG Resources, Inc. 43-013-33168
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

600 17th St., Suite 1000N Denver STATE CO ZIP 80202 (303) 824-5526 Exploratory
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 2,024' FNL & 2,030' FEL 39.902203 LAT110.177633 LON COUNTY: Duchesne

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SWNE 36 10S 15E S.L.B. & M. STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of workcompletion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

AIImaterial, debris, trash, and junk was removed from the location. The reserve pit was reclaimed. Stockpiled topsoilwas
spread over the pit area and broadcast seeded with the prescribed seed mixture. The seeded area was then walked down with
a cat. Interim reclamation was completed on 5/6/2008.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Mary A. Maestas TITLE Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE 1/8/2009

(This space for State use only) RECEIVED
JAN12 2009

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
DMOFOIL,GAS&

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-47051

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnewwells, significantly deepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Big Spring 3-36GR

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

EOG Resources, Inc. 43-013-33168
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

600 17th St., Suite 1000N Denver STATE CO ZIP 80202 (303) 824-5526 Exploratory
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 2,024' FNL & 2,030' FEL 39.902203 LAT110.177633 LON COUNTY: Duchesne

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SWNE 36 10S 15E S.L.B. & M. STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of workcompletion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

AIImaterial, debris, trash, and junk was removed from the location. The reserve pit was reclaimed. Stockpiled topsoilwas
spread over the pit area and broadcast seeded with the prescribed seed mixture. The seeded area was then walked down with
a cat. Interim reclamation was completed on 5/6/2008.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Mary A. Maestas TITLE Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE 1/8/2009

(This space for State use only) RECEIVED
JAN12 2009

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
DMOFOIL,GAS&



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2010

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N9550-EOG Resources, Inc. N3700-QEP Energy Company

1060 E Highway 40 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Vernal, UT 84078 Denver, CO 80265

Phone: 1 (435) 781-9111 Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048

CA No. Unit:
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

NO TYPE STATUSBIG SPRING 3-36 GR 36 100S 150E 4301333168 16229 State OW S CPETES WASH U 14-24 GR 24 100S 160E 4301333202 16232 Federal OW S C
PETES WASH U 13-06 GR 06 100S 160E 4301333203 16233 Federal OW S C
GILSONITE ll-02GR 02 100S 150E 4301333483 16211 State OW S C
BIG WASH 61-16GR 16 100S 160E 4301333485 16192 State OW S C

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 8/19/2010
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 8/19/2010
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/24/20104a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Requested
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM not yet BIA not yet7. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: n/a

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: n/a

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 9/30/2010
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 9/30/2010
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 9/30/2010
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 9/30/2010
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 9/30/2010
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965010693
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965010695
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Divisionof their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a
COMMENTS:

OEP Fnerav FORM A vie in/1

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2010

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N9550-EOG Resources, Inc. N3700-QEP Energy Company

1060 E Highway 40 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Vernal, UT 84078 Denver, CO 80265

Phone: 1 (435) 781-9111 Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048

CA No. Unit:
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

NO TYPE STATUSBIG SPRING 3-36 GR 36 100S 150E 4301333168 16229 State OW S CPETES WASH U 14-24 GR 24 100S 160E 4301333202 16232 Federal OW S C
PETES WASH U 13-06 GR 06 100S 160E 4301333203 16233 Federal OW S C
GILSONITE ll-02GR 02 100S 150E 4301333483 16211 State OW S C
BIG WASH 61-16GR 16 100S 160E 4301333485 16192 State OW S C

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 8/19/2010
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 8/19/2010
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/24/20104a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Requested
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM not yet BIA not yet7. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: n/a

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: n/a

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 9/30/2010
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 9/30/2010
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 9/30/2010
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 9/30/2010
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 9/30/2010
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965010693
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965010695
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Divisionof their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a
COMMENTS:

OEP Fnerav FORM A vie in/1



API Well No: 43013331680000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 'LEA47EœD1ESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:Oil Well BIG SPRING 3-36 GR

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources, Inc. 43013331680000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111 Ext BIG SPRING
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE2024 FNL 2030 FEL

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
STATE:Qtr/Qtr: SWNE Section: 36 Township: 10.05 Range: 15.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIzE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

6/1/2010 O CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

O PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATIONO SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

O TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

O DRILLING REPORT O WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

O WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR Ct MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Please be advised that QEP Energy Company is considered to be the operator

of the referenced well and is responsible under the terms and conditions of the
lease for the operations conducted upon the leased lands. The effective date of

change is June 1, 2010. QEP Energy Company Bond #965010695.

APPROVED /k / o10/o

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Earlene Russell, Engineering Technician

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 8/19/2010

RECEIVED August 19,

API Well No: 43013331680000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 'LEA47EœD1ESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:Oil Well BIG SPRING 3-36 GR

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources, Inc. 43013331680000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111 Ext BIG SPRING
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE2024 FNL 2030 FEL

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
STATE:Qtr/Qtr: SWNE Section: 36 Township: 10.05 Range: 15.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIzE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

6/1/2010 O CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

O PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATIONO SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

O TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

O DRILLING REPORT O WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

O WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR Ct MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Please be advised that QEP Energy Company is considered to be the operator

of the referenced well and is responsible under the terms and conditions of the
lease for the operations conducted upon the leased lands. The effective date of

change is June 1, 2010. QEP Energy Company Bond #965010695.

APPROVED /k / o10/o

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Earlene Russell, Engineering Technician

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 8/19/2010

RECEIVED August 19,
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referencedwellandis responsibleunderthetermsandconditionsof theleaseforthe
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Date Í:P
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' State of Utah
- DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER
GARY R.HERBERT Executive Director

Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GREGORY S. BELL JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Govemor Division Director

September 14, 2012

CERTIFIED MAIL NO.: 70110110000135682325

QEP Energy Company
11002 East 17500 South
Vernal, UT 84078

Subject: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned Well Requirements for Fee or State Leases

Dear Mr. Angus:

As of January 2012, QuestarExploration & Production (Questar)has nine (9) State
Lease Wells (see attachment A) that are currently in non-compliance with the requirements for
extended shut-in or temporarily abandoned (SI/TA) status. Four (4) of the above wells have been
issued and are currently under Notices of Violation. The remaining five (5) wells have been
added to Questar'sSI/TA list this year.

Wells with five (5) years non-activity or non-productivity shall be plugged, unless the
Division grants approval for extended shut-in time upon a showing of good cause by the operator(649-3-36-1.3.3). Wells SI/TA beyond twelve (12) consecutive months requires filing a Sundry
Notice (R649-3-36-1).

For extended SI/TA consideration the operator shall provide the Utah Division of Oil,
Gas & Mining with the following:

1. Reasons for SI/TA of the well (R649-3-36-1.1).

2. The length of time the well is expected to be SI/TA (R649-3-36-1.2), and

3. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well has
integrity, meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition, static fluid level,
pressure, existence or absence of Underground Sources of Drinking Water and
other factors do not make the well a risk to public health and safety or the
environment (R649-3-36-1.3).

UTAH

DNR

1594 WestNorth Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City,UT 84114 -5801

telephone (801) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 •TTY (801) 538-7458 • www.ogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS &
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Page 2
QEP Energy Company
September 14, 2012

Please note that the Divisions preferred method for showing well integrity is by MIT.

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity and mayhelp qualify your well for extended SI/TA. Note: As of July 1, 2003, wells in violation of theSI/TA rule R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-1-4.2, 4.3).

1. Wellbore diagram, and
2. Copy of recent casing pressure test, and
3. Current pressures on the wellbore (tubing pressure, casing pressure, and

casing/casing annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity, and4. Fluid level in the wellbore, and
5. An explanation of how the submitted information proves integrity.

If the required information is not received within 30 days of the date of this notice,further actions may be initiated. If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contactme at (801) 538-5281.

cerely

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

DKD/JPlear

cc: LaVonne Garrison, SITLA
Compliance File
Well File

N:\O&G Reviewed
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ATTACHMENT A

Well Name API LEASE Years Inactive
1'' NOTICE

1 BlG SPRING 3-36 GR 43-013-33168 ML-47051 2 Years 4 Months
2 GlLSONITE 11-02 GR 43-013-33483 ML-47049 2 Years 5 Months
3 BIGWASH 61-16 GR 43-013-33485 ML-47000 2 Years 5 Months
4 GB 4SG-36-8-21 43-047-38764 ML-22051 1 Year 1 Month
5 GB 7SG-36-8-21 43-047-38765 ML-22051 1 Year 8 Months

OUTSTANDINGNOVs
6 TOLL STATION ST 8-36 43-047-32724 ML-22051 15 Years 6 Months
7 OU GB 8W-16-8-22 43-047-34660 ML-22049 8 Years 8 Months
8 OU GB 15G-16-8-22 43-047-34829 ML-22049 7 Years 2 Months
9 WV 16W-2-8-21 43-047-33645 ML-2785 6 Years 2
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RECEIVED: Oct. 16, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML-47051 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 BIG SPRING 3-36 GR 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43013331680000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 BIG SPRING 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2024 FNL 2030 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWNE Section: 36 Township: 10.0S Range: 15.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

11 /1 /2012

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 QEP Energy Company requests approval to plug and abandon this well
as follows: 1- MIRU workover rig and 5000' 2 7/8" workstring. 2- ND
WH and NU BOP. 3- PU and RIH with scraper to 4700', POOH. 4- POOH
and laydown 2300' tubing. 5- RU wireline, RIH set CIBP at 4620' cap
with 35' of cmt. 6- Fill hole with minimum 9 ppg KCL. 7- RIH with

tubing to ±2350, balance 100' cement plug from 2350'-2250'. 8- Pull
up to 577' (laying down), balance 100' cement plug 50' above and
below the surface casing shoe. 9- POOH, place 50' cement plug at

surface. 10- ND BOPs, topout surface plug if necessary. 11- RDMO cut
off wellhead install dryhole marker. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Valyn Davis 435 781-4369

TITLE
 Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 10/16/2012

October 23, 2012

Sundry Number: 31086 API Well Number: 43013331680000Sundry Number: 31086 API Well Number: 43013331680000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH
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and laydown 2300' tubing. 5- RU wireline, RIH set CIBP at 4620' cap Date: October 23, 2012
with 35' of cmt. 6- Fill hole with minimum 9 ppg KCL. 7- RIH with

tubing to ±2350, balance 100' cement plug from 2350'-2250'. 8- Pull sy: \ J Li
up to 577' (laying down), balance 100' cement plug 50' above and
below the surface casing shoe. 9- POOH, place 50' cement plug at

surface. 10- ND BOPs, topout surface plug if necessary. 11- RDMO cut
off wellhead install dryhole marker.
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RECEIVED: Oct. 23, 2012

  

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43013331680000

1. Notify the Division at least 24 hours prior to conducting abandonment operations. Please call
Dan Jarvis at 801-538-5338. 2. Amend Plug #1: 100’ (12 sx) shall be placed on top of CIBP @

4620’ not 35’ as proposed (R649-3-24-3.2) 

3. Add Plug #1A: A 100’ plug (±12 sx) shall be balanced from ±4250’ to 4150’. This will isolate
the base of the Moderately Saline Groundwater as required by rule R649-3-24-3.3. 

4. Amend Plug #4: This plug shall be an inside/outside plug. RIH and perforate @ 100’. Establish
circulation down the 5 ½” casing back up the 5 ½” x 9 5/8” annulus. M&P 35 sx cement, pump

down 5 ½” casing through perfs back up the annulus to surface. 

5. All balanced plugs shall be tagged to ensure that they are at the depth specified. 

6. All annuli shall be cemented from a minimum depth of 100’ to the surface. 

7. Surface reclamation shall be done in accordance with R649-3-34 – Well Site Restoration. 

8. All requirements in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-24 shall apply. 

9. If there are any changes to the procedure or the wellbore configuration, notify Dustin Doucet
at 801-538-5281 (ofc) or 801-733-0983 (home) prior to continuing with the procedure. 

10. All other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation General
Rules shall apply. 

Sundry Number: 31086 API Well Number: 43013331680000Sundry Number: 31086 API Well Number: 43013331680000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources
Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

TI, BAS Pr NINTfdG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43013331680000

1. Notify the Division at least 24 hours prior to conducting abandonment operations. Please call
Dan Jarvis at 801-538-5338. 2. Amend Plug #1: 100' (12 sx) shall be placed on top of CIBP @

4620' not 35' as proposed (R649-3-24-3.2)

3. Add Plug #1A: A 100' plug (±12 sx) shall be balanced from ±4250' to 4150'. This will isolate
the base of the Moderately Saline Groundwater as required by rule R649-3-24-3.3.

4. Amend Plug #4: This plug shall be an insideloutside plug. RIH and perforate @ 100'. Establish
circulation down the 5 ½" casing back up the 5 ½" x 9 5/8" annulus. M&P 35 sx cement, pump

down 5 ½" casing through perfs back up the annulus to surface.

5. AII balanced plugs shall be tagged to ensure that they are at the depth specified.

6. AII annuli shall be cemented from a minimum depth of 100' to the surface.

7. Surface reclamation shall be done in accordance with R649-3-34 - Well Site Restoration.

8. AII requirements in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-24 shall apply.

9. If there are any changes to the procedure or the wellbore configuration, notify Dustin Doucet
at 801-538-5281 (ofc) or 801-733-0983 (home) prior to continuing with the procedure.

10. AII other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation General
Rules shall apply.

RECEIVED: Oct. 23,
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RECEIVED: Oct. 23, 2012

Sundry Number: 31086 API Well Number: 43013331680000Sundry Number: 31086 API Well Number: 43013331680000

10/16/2012 Wellbore Diagram r263

API Well No: 43-013-33168-00-00 Permit No: Well Name/No: BIG SPRING 3-36 GR

Company Name: QEP ENERGY COMPANY

Location: Sec: 36 T: 10S R: 15E Spot: SWNE String Information

Coordinates: X: 570235 Y: 4417217 Bottom Diameter Weight Length CF
String (ft sub) (inches) (Ib/ft) (ft)

Field Name: BIG SPRING
HOL1 527 12.25

County Name: DUCHESNE SURF 527 9.625 9 2 36 527 o _ 3 J
HOL2 4965 7.875 /10 a 4, i 3 7
PROD 4965 5.5 17 4965 ., l éc. I
Tl 4880 2.875

Cement from 527 ft to surface

Surface: 9.625 in. @527 ft

1 : 12.25 in. @527 11. C

Cement Information
BOC TOC

String (ft sub) (ft sub) Class Sacks
PROD 4965 540 UK 680

SURF 527 0 UK 250

Perforation Information

Top Bottom
(ft sub) (ft sub) Shts/Ft No Shts Dt Squeeze
4668 4836

Formation Information & 700 ' Cur / $7CÑÙÑ/Él.
Formation Depth
BMSW 4200 Û / /vX,.raes) = //sar
GRRV 4668 /fd

Cement from 4965 ft to 540 ft

Tubing: 2.875 in. @4880 ft

Production: 5.5 in. @4965 ft

Ilole: 7.875 in. @4965 ft * Ÿíad < /DC, o CM P

T ): 4980 TVD: 4980 PBTD: 4918
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4668 4836

Formation Information & 700 ' Cur / $7CÑÙÑ/Él.
Formation Depth
BMSW 4200 Û / /vX,.raes) = //sar
GRRV 4668 /fd

Cement from 4965 ft to 540 ft

Tubing: 2.875 in. @4880 ft

Production: 5.5 in. @4965 ft

Ilole: 7.875 in. @4965 ft * Ÿíad < /DC, o CM P

T ): 4980 TVD: 4980 PBTD: 4918

Page



RECEIVED: Oct. 15, 2013

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML-47051 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 BIG SPRING 3-36 GR 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43013331680000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 BIG SPRING 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2024 FNL 2030 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWNE Section: 36 Township: 10.0S Range: 15.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

9 /18 /2013

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 QEP ENERGY COMPANY PLUGGED AND ABANDONED THE ABOVE
REFERENCED WELL ON 09/18/2013 AS FOLLOWS: 1. PLUG 1 AND 1A:

SET CIBP @ 4620' AND CAP WITH 58 SX CLASS B CEMENT. TOC @ 4095'.
2. PLUG 2: BALANCE A PLUG FROM 2351' - 2134' WITH 24 SX CEMENT.

3. PLUG 2A: RE-BALANCE A PLUG FROM 2351' - 2134' WITH 24 SX.
TAGGED AT 2169'. 4. PLUG 3: BALANCE A PLUG FROM 577' - 415' WITH

18 SX. TAG AT 450'. 5. PLUG 4: SHOOT HOLES AND ESTABLISH
CIRCULATION AT 100'. PUMP 42 SX CEMENT AND FILL CASING AND
ANNULUS WITH CEMENT. 6. CUT OFF WELLHEAD AND WELD ON DRY
HOLE MARKER. 7. SPACER FLUID USED HAD BIOCIDE AND CORROSION INHIBITOR. DENNIS INGRAM

WITH UDGM WITNESSED PLUGGING OPERATIONS.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Benna Muth 435 781-4320

TITLE
 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 10/15/2013

October 15, 2013

Sundry Number: 43778 API Well Number: 43013331680000Sundry Number: 43778 API Well Number: 43013331680000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-47051

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well BIG SPRING 3-36 GR

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43013331680000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext BIGSPRING

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

2024 FNL 2030 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWNE Section: 36 Township: 10.0S Range: 15.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

9/18/2013
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP ENERGY COMPANY PLUGGED ANDABANDONEDTHE ABOVE Accepted by the
REFERENCED WELL ON 09/18/2013 AS FOLLOWS: 1. PLUG 1 AND 1A: Utah Division of

SET CIBP @4620' AND CAP WITH 58 SX CLASS B CEMENT. TOC @4095'. Oil, Gas and Mining

2. PLUG 2: BALANCE A PLUG FROM 2351' - 2134' WITH 24 SX CEMENT. FOR RECORD ONLY
3. PLUG 2A: RE-BALANCE A PLUG FROM 2351' - 2134' WITH 24 SX. October 15, 2013

TAGGED AT 2169'. 4. PLUG 3: BALANCE A PLUG FROM 577' - 415' WITH
18 SX. TAG AT 450'. 5. PLUG 4: SHOOT HOLES AND ESTABLISH

CIRCULATION AT 100'. PUMP 42 SX CEMENT AND FILL CASING AND
ANNULUS WITH CEMENT. 6. CUT OFF WELLHEADAND WELD ON DRY
HOLE MARKER. 7. SPACER FLUID USED HAD BIOCIDEAND CORROSION INHIBITOR.DENNIS INGRAM

WITH UDGMWITNESSED PLUGGING OPERATIONS.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Benna Muth 435 781-4320 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 10/15/2013

RECEIVED: Oct. 15,

Sundry Number: 43778 API Well Number: 43013331680000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-47051

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well BIG SPRING 3-36 GR

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43013331680000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext BIGSPRING

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

2024 FNL 2030 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWNE Section: 36 Township: 10.0S Range: 15.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

9/18/2013
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP ENERGY COMPANY PLUGGED ANDABANDONEDTHE ABOVE Accepted by the
REFERENCED WELL ON 09/18/2013 AS FOLLOWS: 1. PLUG 1 AND 1A: Utah Division of

SET CIBP @4620' AND CAP WITH 58 SX CLASS B CEMENT. TOC @4095'. Oil, Gas and Mining

2. PLUG 2: BALANCE A PLUG FROM 2351' - 2134' WITH 24 SX CEMENT. FOR RECORD ONLY
3. PLUG 2A: RE-BALANCE A PLUG FROM 2351' - 2134' WITH 24 SX. October 15, 2013

TAGGED AT 2169'. 4. PLUG 3: BALANCE A PLUG FROM 577' - 415' WITH
18 SX. TAG AT 450'. 5. PLUG 4: SHOOT HOLES AND ESTABLISH

CIRCULATION AT 100'. PUMP 42 SX CEMENT AND FILL CASING AND
ANNULUS WITH CEMENT. 6. CUT OFF WELLHEADAND WELD ON DRY
HOLE MARKER. 7. SPACER FLUID USED HAD BIOCIDEAND CORROSION INHIBITOR.DENNIS INGRAM

WITH UDGMWITNESSED PLUGGING OPERATIONS.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Benna Muth 435 781-4320 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 10/15/2013

RECEIVED: Oct. 15,



FORM 9 STATE OF UTAH 
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER: 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells. significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to 
drill horizontal laterals_ Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals, 

1. TYPE OF WELL 
OIL WELL III GAS WELL D OTHER ________________________ _ 

2- NAME OF OPERATOR: 

QEPENERGYCOMPANY 

STATE UT ZIP 84078 I PHONE NUMBER: 

(435) 781-4308 
3. ADORESS OF OPERATOR: 

11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH CITY VERNAL 

4. LOCATION OF WELL 

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 2024 FNL 2030 FEL 

OTR/OTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE. MERIDIAN: SWNE 36 10S 15E S 

ML-47051 
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME: 

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME: 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER: 

BIG SPRING 3-36 GR 
9. APt NUMBER: 

4301333168 
10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT: 

BIG SPRING 

COUNTY: DUCHESNE 

STATE: 

UTAH 

,,- CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION 

D D ACIDIZE D DEEPEN D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION 
NOTICE OF INTENT 

(Submit in Duplicate) D ALTER CASING D FRACTURE TREAT D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL 

Approximate date work will start: D CASING REPAIR D NEW CONSTRUCTION D TEMPORARILY ABANDON 

D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D OPERATOR CHANGE D TUBING REPAIR 

D CHANGE TUBING D PLUG AND ABANDON D VENT OR FLARE 

[2] SUBSEQUENT REPORT D CHANGE WELL NAME D PLUG BACK D WATER DISPOSAL 
(Submit Original Form Only) 

D CHANGE WELL STATUS D PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) D WATER SHUT-OFF 
Date of work completion: 

D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS I2l RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D OTHER: 
11/26/2013 D D CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc. 

The Big Spring 3-36 was reclaimed on November 26, 2013. All equipment was removed, the location and access road were 
recontoured, mulched, and seeded. The seed mix used was: 

Grass Indian ricegrass Achnatherum hymenoides Rimrock 4 PLS LBS/ACRE 
Grass Western wheatgrass Pascopyrum smithii Rosana 3 PLS LBS/ACRE a 'o~ t\le 
Grass Thickspike wheatgrass Elymus lanceolatus Bannock 2 PLS LBS/ACRE .... ~\e • \01\ ot 
Grass Sandberg bluegrass Poa secunda VNS 3 PLS LBS/ACRE ,... ~ 'O\,,\S ~1\ce 
Grass Needle and thread Hesperostipa comata ssp. Comata VNS 2 PLS LBS/ACRE \)\'1'" O~ 8.t\~ "0.:\1;{ 
Grass Crested Wheatgrass Agropyron cristatum Ephraim 4 PLS LBS/ACRE 0\\' -.d.1) O~"""t. .... 
Grass Pubescent Wheatgrass Elytrigia intermedia spp. Trichophrum mandon or green leaf ~~.~CRE 
Grass Russian Wild rye Psathyrostachys juncea Bozoiski 4 PLS LBS/ACRE -cO\t \'P ..... 
Forb Wyeth buckwheat Erigonum heracleoides 0.5 PLS LBS/ACRE I.' 

Forb Prarie Aster Aster 1 PLS LBS/ACRE 
Shrub Rubber rabbitbrush Chrysothamnus viscidiflorous 0.5 PLS LBS/ACRE 
Shrub Forage Kochia Kochia prostrate 2 PLS LBS/ACRE [iCC iii 0 20 4 
Shrub Fourwing Saltbush Atriplex canescens 2 PLS LBS/ACRE 
TOTAL 31 PLS LBS/ACRE 

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) STEPHANIE TOMKINSON 

StGNflTU~~ 
(This space for State use only) 

(512000) 

TITLE 

DATE 

(See Instructions on Reverse Side) 

SR. BIOLOGIST 

12/30/2014 

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:
ML-47051

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLÑAME and NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER BIG SPRING 3-36 GR

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. AP1NUMBER.

QEP ENERGY COMPANY 4301333168
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH

,
VERNAL UT ,84078 (435) 781-4308 BIG SPRING

4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 2024 FNL 2030 FEL COUNTY: DUCHESNE

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SWNE 36 10S 15E S STATE:

UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:
11/26/2013

CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The Big Spring 3-36 was reclaimed on November 26, 2013. All equipment was removed, the location and access road were
recontoured, mulched, and seeded. The seed mix used was:

Grass Indian ricegrass Achnatherum hymenoides Rimrock 4 PLS LBS/ACRE
Grass Western wheatgrass Pascopyrum smithii Rosana 3 PLS LBS/ACRE
Grass Thickspike wheatgrass Elymus lanceolatus Bannock 2 PLS LBS/ACRE gecCŸ 00
Grass Sandberg bluegrass Poa secunda VNS 3 PLS LBS/ACRE 96
Grass Needle and thread Hesperostipa comata ssp. Comata VNS 2 PLS LBS/ACRE
Grass Crested Wheatgrass Agropyron cristatum Ephraim 4 PLS LBS/ACRE o O
Grass Pubescent Wheatgrass Elytrigia intermedia spp. Trichophrum mandon or green leaf CRE
Grass Russian Wildrye Psathyrostachys juncea Bozoiski 4 PLS LBS/ACRE -OS
Forb Wyeth buckwheat Erigonum heracleoides 0.5 PLS LBS/ACRE
Forb Prarie Aster Aster 1 PLS LBS/ACRE
Shrub Rubber rabbitbrush Chrysothamnus viscidiflorous 0.5 PLS LBS/ACRE
Shrub Forage Kochia Kochia prostrate 2 PLS LBS/ACRE
Shrub Fourwing Saltbush Atriplex canescens 2 PLS LBS/ACRE
TOTAL 31 PLS LBS/ACRE

STEPHANIE TOMKINSON SR. BIOLOGIST

(This space for State use only)

{5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



INSTRUCTIONS 

This fonn shall be submitted by the operator to show the intention and/or completion of the following: 
• miscellaneous work projects and actions for which other specific report forms do not exist; 
• all other work and events as identified in section 11, Type of Action, or as required by the Utah Oil and Gas 

Conservation General Rules, including: 
- minor deepening of an existing well bore, 
- plugging back a well, 
- recompleting to a different producing formation within an existing well bore (intent only), 
- reperforatiilg the current producing formation, 
- drilling a sidetrack to repair a well, 
- reporting monthly the status of each drilling well. 

This fonn Is not to be used for proposals to 
- drill new wells, 
- reenter previously plugged and abandoned wells, 
- significantly deepen existing wells below their current bottom-hole depth, 
- drill horizontal laterals from an existing well bore, 
- drill hydrocarbon exploratory holes such as core samples and stratigraphic tests. 

Use Fonn 3, Application for Permit to Drill (APD) for such proposals. 

NOTICE OF INTENT - A notice of intention to do work on a well or to change plans previously approved shall be 
submitted in duplicate and must be received and approved by the division before the work is commenced. The operator 
is responsible for receipt of the notice by the division in ample time for proper consideration and action. In cases of 
emergency, the operator may obtain verbal approval to commence work. 'Mthin five days after receiving verbal approval, 
the operator shall submit a Sundry Notice describing the work ~nd acknowledging the verbal approval. 

SUBSEQUENT REPORT - A subsequent report shall be submitted to the division within 30 days of the completion of 
the outlined work. Specific details of the work performed should be provided, including dates, well depths, placement 
of plugs, etc. 

WELL ABANDONMENT - Proposals to abandon a well and subsequent reports of abandonment should include reasons 
for the abandonment; data on any former or present productive zones, or other zones with present significant fluid 
contents not sealed off by cement or otherwise; depths (top and bottom) and method of placement of cement plugs; 
mud or other material placed below, between and above plugs; amount, size, and method of parting of any casing, liner, 
or tubing pulled and the depth to top of any left in the hole; method of closing top of well; and date well site conditioned 
for final inspection looking to approval of the abandonment. 

In addition to any Sundry Notice forms submitted, Fonn 8, 'Well Completion or Recompletion Report and Log must 
be submitted to the division to report the I1WI.I1i of the following operations: 
• completing or plugging a new well, 
• reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well, 
• Significantly deepening an existing well bore below the current bottom-hole depth, 
• drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore, 
• drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes such as core samples and stratigraphiC tests, 
• recompleting to a different producing formation. 

Send to: 

Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining 
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210 
Box 145801 
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801 

(!"mOO) 

Phone: 801-538-5340 

Fax: 801-359-3940 

REG!='!\JED 
DEC 30 2014 

INSTRUCTIONS

This form shall be submitted úy the operator to show the intention andlor completion of the following:
e miscènaneousworkprojects and actions for which other specificreport forms do not exist;
e all other work and events as identified in section 11, Type of Action, or as required by the Utah Oil and Gas

Conservation General Rules, including:
- minordeepening of an existingwell bore,
- plugging back a well,
- recompleting to a different producing formation withinan existing weit bore (intent only),
- reperforating thecurrent producing formation,
- drillinga sidetrackto repaira well,
- reporting monthly the status of each drillingwell.

This form Is not to be used for oronosals to
- drillnew wells,
- reenter previously plugged and abandonedwells,
- significantlydeepen existing wells below theircurrentbottom-hole depth,
- drillhorizontal laterals from an existingwell bore,
- drillhydrocarbon exploratoryholes such as core samples and stratigraphic tests.

Use Form 3, Application for Permit to Drill (APD) for such proposals.

NOTICE OF INTENT - A notice of intention to do work on a well or to change plans previously approved shall be
submittedin duplicate and must be received and approvedby thedivisionbefore thework is commenced. The operator
is responsible for receiptof the notice by thedivision in ample timefor proper considerationand action. In cases of
emergency,theoperator may obtainverbal approvaltocommence work. Withinfivedays after receiving verbal approval,
the operator shall submit a Sundry Notice describing thework and acknowledging the verbal approval.

SUBSEQUENT REPORT - A subsequent report shall be submitted to the division within 30 days of the completion of
the outlined work. Specific details of the work performed shouldbe provided, including dates, well depths, placement
of plugs, etc.

WELL ABANDONMENT-Proposals toabandona welland subsequentreports of abandonment shouldinclude reasons
for the abandonment; data on any former or present productive zones, or other zones with present significantfluid
contents not sealed off by cement or othenwise;depths (topand bottom) and method of placement of cement plugs;
mud or other material placed below, between and above plugs; amount, size, and method of partingofany casing,liner,
or tubingpulled and the depth to topof any left in thehole; method of closing top of well; and date well site conditioned
for final inspection looking to approvalof theabandonment.

Inadditiontoany Sundry Notice forms submitted,Form 8, Well Completion or Recompletion Report and Log must
be submittedto the division to report the results of thefollowingoperations:
e completingor plugging a new well,
e reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well,
e significantlydeepening an existingwell bore below the currentbottom-hole depth,
e drillinghorizontal laterals from an existingwell bore,
e drillinghydrocarbon exploratoryholes such as core samples and stratigraphictests,
e recompleting to a different producing formation.

Send to: REC D
Utah Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340 DEC3 0 2014
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940 Qy.Og
Salt Lake City, Utah
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