STATE OF UTAH ) FORM 3

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
AMENDED REPORT [ |

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING (highiight changes)
I o 5. MINERAL LEASE NO.: 6. SURFACE:
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL UTU.76032 BLM
1A TYPE OF WORK: DRILL REENTER l:l DEEPEN D 7. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
N/A
B. TyPEOFWELL: OIL[J GAS X OTHER SINGLE ZONE XJ MULTIPLE ZONE [J 8. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Wilkin Ridge
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gasco Production Company Wilkin Ridge Federal #14-4-11-17
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Drive East, Suite #100, Englewood, CO 80112 303-483-0044 —WitiieRidge, 1/\1 L Ap g £
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) ~ - 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE
5 ?5 Sz &251 . 9 Sy 2 MERIDIAN:
AT SURFACE: 856' FSL and 752' FWL Sec. 4, TI1S-R17E
AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONE: SwW Sw Z e f
Yy irdgizy o /
14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: 12, COUNTX . 13. STATE:
. . . s S
Approximately 27.1 miles southeast of Myton, UT. UTAH
15. DISTANCE TO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE (FEET) 16. NUMBER OF ACRES IN LEASE: 17. NUMBER 8F ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:
752' 797.12 40 Acres; SW SW
18. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING, COMPLETED, OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:
APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET):
None 12,580' Bond No. UT-1233
21. ELEVATIONS (SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATE DATE WORK WILL START: 23. ESTIMATED DURATION:
6393 GL ASAP 35 Days
24, PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT | SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY, YIELD, AND SLURRY WEIGHT
17-1/2" 13-3/8", H-40, 48# 200' 200 sx Premium Type 5, 15.6 ppg, 1.18 yield
12-1/4" 8-5/8", J-55, 32# 3,345' | 552 sx Hi-Lift, 11 ppg, 3.91 yield + 185 sx 10-2 RFC, 14.2 ppg, 1.63 yield
7-7/8" 4-1/2", P-110, 13.5# 12,580' | 523 sx Hi-Lift, 11.5 ppg, 3.05 yield & 1230 sx 50/50 Poz, 14.1 ppg, 1.28 yield
COMHDETTIALTIGAT EOLE
25 ATTACHMENTS

VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES:

WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLING PROGRAM

EVIDENCE OF DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER D FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANY OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

AGENT: PermitCo Inc. AGENT'S PHONE NO.:  303-857-9999
NAME (PLEASE PRINT) o _VENESSa Langmacher mme  Agent for Gasco Production Company

SIGNATURE \/J/Vu,dﬂ/l, QGK\WVHMM oate _ March 15, 2006

(This space for State use only)

. ™™ Approved by the
API NUMBER ASSIGNED: qj "(—)I 3’3’ 3 ¢ qcf Utah Ringsion of 9 - RECE‘VED

MAR 17 2006

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

(11/2001) Foderal Approval of this

Action Js Nocessary




32

i T11S, RI7E, S.L.B.&M.

GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

Well Location, WILKIN RIDGE FEDERAL
#14—4-11-17, located as shown in the SW 1/4

[~ —S8956'15"W — 2642.73" (Meas.)—\| 5 pie
L1 of Stones l T70 S
1909 rose cop, ,c_(}gg fros EAST — 5280 (G.L.O.) T11S
1.5° High, Pile Cop, 2.3 High,
of Stones PZ/; of SI‘OI;Z’S
LOT 4 LOT 3 LOT 2 LOT 1

SW 1/4 of Section 4, T11S, R17E, S.L.B.&M.
Duchesne County, Utah.

BASIS OF ELEVATION

SPOT ELEVATION AT A ROAD INTERSECTION LOCATED IN
THE NW 1/4 OF SECTION 4, T11S, R17E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN
FROM THE WILKIN RIDGE, QUADRANGLE, UTAH, DUCHESNE
COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTE QUAD. (TOPOGRAPHIC MAP)

NOO'O5'02"W — 2613.18" (Mecs. to True)
NOOO5'02"W — 2613.04° (Meas. to C.C.)

PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE
INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL SURVEY. SAID ELEVATION IS
MARKED AS BEING 6352 FEET.

4

1909 Brass Cap,
2.2' High, Pile of
Stones,

S000505E — 2636.00° (Meos.)

©
]
[ee]

WILKIN RIDGE FEDERAL
#l14—4—11-17
Elev. Ungraded Ground = 6393’

1909 Brass Cap,
1.0° High, Pile of
Stones
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SCALE
CERTIFICATE

THIS 1S TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE PLAT WAS PREPARED FROM
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MADE BY ME OR UNDER MY
SUPERVISION AND THAT THE SAME ARE

UE AND CORRECT TP THI
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE AND B %

REGISTERED LAND SURVEYOR
REGISTRATION NO. 161319

1909 Brass Cop,
1.5" High, Pite of Mk
Stones

LINE TABLE
LUNE | DIRECTION | LENGTH
L1 _[S8956°43"W [ 1057.17’
LEGEND:

| = 90" symBoL
o PROPOSED WELL HEAD.
A = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED.

NBI'56°02"E — 2646.35 (Meas.)

NB9'58'W — 2640.66' (G.L.O.)

BASIS OF BEARINGS
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.

(AUTONOMOUS NAD 83)

LATITUDE = 39°52’52.14" (39.891150)
LONGITUDE = 110°01°25.20" (110.023667)
(AUTONOMOUS NAD 27)

LATITUDE = 3952'52.27" (39.881186)
LONGITUDE = 110°01°22.66" (110.022961)

STATE OF UTAH

UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078
(435) 789-1017

SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:

1” = 1000’ 9-27-05 10-17-05
PARTY REFERENCES

J. L.W. K.G. G.L.O. PLAT
WEATHER FILE

cooL GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY
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United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO:

3160
(UT-922)

April 19, 2006
Memorandum
To: Assistant District Manager Minerals, Vernal District
From: Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer

Subject: 2006 Plan of Development Wilkin Ridge Unit, Duchesne and
Uintah County, Utah.

Pursuant to email between Diana Whitney, Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, and Mickey
Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land Management, the following wells are
planned for calendar year 2006 within the Wilkin Ridge Unit, Duchesne County, Utah.

APl # WELL NAME LOCATION
(Proposed PZ Blackhawk)

* 43-013-33088 WR Fed 14-17-10-17 Sec 17 T10S R17E 0659 FSL 0656 FWL
*43-013-33087 WR Fed 32-20-10-17 Sec 20 T10S R17E 1923 FNL 2076 FEL
/ 43-013-33097 WR Fed 12-20-10-17 Sec 20 T10S R17E 2151 FNL 0464 FWL
7 43-013-33096 WR Fed 23-21-10-17 Sec 21 T10S R17E 1796 FSL 2178 FWL
# 43-013-33095 WR Fed 21-28-10-17 Sec 28 T10S R17E 0709 FNL 2115 FWL
.~ 43-013-33099 WR Fed 14-04-11-17 Sec 04 T11S R17E 0856 FSL 0752 FWL
. 43-013-33125 WR Fed 11-29-10-17 Sec 29 T10S R17E 0802 FNL. 0516 FWL
» 43-013-33124 WR Fed 11-17-10-17 Sec 17 T10S R17E 0463 FNL 0816 FWL

This office has no objection to permitting the wells at this time.

/s/ Michael L. Coulthard

bcc:  File — Wilkin Ridge Unit
Division of Qil Gas and Mining
Central Files
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron
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PE RMITC(

14421 County Rd. 10 « Ft. Lupton, Colorado 80621 ¢ (303) 857-9999 = FAX (303) 857-0577 » E-MAIL Permitco 1@aqol.com

March 15, 2006

Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210

Box 145801

Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Attn: Minerals

Re: Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal #14-4-11-17
856' FSL and 752' FWL
SW SW Section 4, T11S - R17E
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Enclosed please find one copy of the Application for Permit to Drill, along with one copy of the Onshore
Order No. 1 which was filed with the BLM in Vernal, Utah.

If you should need additional information, please don't hesitate to contact me. Approved copies of the
A.P.D. should be sent to Permitco Inc. at the address shown above.

Sincerely,

PERMITCO INC.

WLMWW

Venessa Langmacher
Consultant for
Gasco Production Company

F RECENVTT

\’sn

MAR 14 2055

Enc.

cc: Gasco Production Company - Englewood, CO

Shawn Elworthy - Roosevelt, UT DIV. OF OiL, GAS & MINING



CONFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1

Approval of Operations on Onshore
Federal and Indian Oil & Gas Leases

Wilkin Ridge Federal #14-4-11-17
856' FSL and 752' FWL
SW SW Section 4, T11S - R17E
Duchesne County, Utah

Prepared For:

Gasco Production Company

<
By: « \?\QX‘
o
PERMITCO INC. \:&\ ‘
14421 County Road 10 “\;\a\
Ft. Lupton, Colorado 80621 .;;»\é"“’i“ﬁ’?‘*
303/857-9999 ,.wifk
o)

Copies Sent To:

3 - Bureau of Land Management - Vernal, UT

1 - Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining - Salt Lake City, UT
2 - Gasco Production Company - Englewood, CO

1 - Shawn Elworthy - Roosevelt, UT




APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRI.- OR REENTER
24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor.
Attached.

2. A Drilling Plan
See Drilling Program Attached.

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the SUPO shall be filed with the Appropriate Forest
Service Office.
See Surface Use Plan Attached.

4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see Item 20).
Bond coverage for this well is provided by Gasco Production Company under their BLM Bond No. Bond No. UT-1233.

5. Operator certification.
Please be advised that Gasco Production Company is considered to be the operator of the above mentioned well.
Gasco Production Company agrees to be responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease for the operations
conducted upon the leased lands.

6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the authorized officer.



ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 LONFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal #14-4-11-17 Lease No. UTU-76032
856' FSL and 752' FWL

SW SW Section 4, T11S - R17E DRILLING PROGRAM
Duchesne County, Utah Page 1

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore
Federal and Indian Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made with applicable
laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, and the approved plan of operations. The
operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished
the field representative to insure compliance.

1. ESTIMATED TOPS OF IMPORTANT GEOLOGIC MARKERS

Formation Depth Subsea
Wasatch 4,795' +1,580
Mesa Verde 8,800' -2,425'
Castlegate 11,325' -4,950'
Blackhawk 11,555' -5,180'
Aberdeen 12,280' -5,905'
T.D. 12,580 -6,205'

2. ESTIMATED DEPTH OF ANTICIPATED WATER, OIL, GAS OR MINERAL FORMATIONS:

Substance Formation Depth
Gas Wasatch 4,900'-8,800'
Gas Mesaverde 8,800'-11,325'
Gas Blackhawk 11,555'-12,200'

All fresh water prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling, will be recorded
by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested to determine

commercial potential.




ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 LONFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal #14-4-11-17 Lease No. UTU-76032
856' FSL and 752' FWL

SW SW Section 4, T11S - R17E DRILLING PROGRAM
Duchesne County, Utah Page 2
3. PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT

Gasco Production Company’s minimum specifications for pressure control equipment are as follows:
Ram Type: 11" Hydraulic double with annular, 5000 psi w.p.

Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved stack working pressure
if isolated by test plug or to 70 percent of internal yield pressure of casing. Pressure shall be
maintained for at least 10 minutes or until requirements of test are met, whichever is longer. If a test
plug is utilized, no bleed-off pressure is acceptable. For a test not utilizing a test plug, if a decline in
pressure of more than 10 percent in 30 minutes occurs, the test shall be considered to have failed.
Valve on casing head below test plug shall be open during test of BOP stack.

Annular type preventers (if used) shall be tested to 50 percent of rated working pressure. Pressure
shall be maintained at least 10 minutes or until provisions of test are met, whichever is longer.

As a minimum, the above test shall be performed:

a when initially installed;

b. whenever any seal subject to test pressure is broken
c following related repairs; and

d at 30-day intervals

Valves shall be tested from working pressure side during BOPE tests with all down stream valves
open.

When testing the kill line valve(s) the check vaive shall be held open or the ball removed.
Annular preventers shall be functionally operated at least weekly.

Pipe and blind rams shall be activated each trip, however, this function need not be performed more
than once a day.

A BOPE pit level drill shall be conducted weekly for each drilling crew.
Pressure tests shall apply to all related well control equipment.

All of the above described tests and/or drills shall be recorded in the drilling log.




ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 LONFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal #14-4-11-17 Lease No. UTU-76032
856' FSL and 752' FWL

SW SW Section 4, T11S - R17E DRILLING PROGRAM
Duchesne County, Utah Page 3

BOP systems shall be consistent with API RP53. Pressure tests will be conducted before drilling out
from under casing strings which have been set and cemented in place. Blowout preventer controls
will be installed prior to drilling the surface casing plug and will remain in use until the well is completed
or abandoned. Preventers will be inspected and operated at least daily to ensure good mechanical
working order, and this inspection will be recorded on the daily drilling report. Preventers will be
pressure tested before drilling casing cement plugs.

The District Office should be notified, with sufficient lead time, in order to have the BLM representative
on location during pressure testing.

a.

The size and rating of the BOP stack is shown on the attached diagram. Although a rig has
not been chosen to drill this well, most of the equipment fof this depth of hole in the area use
a 11", 5000 psi working pressure blowout preventor.

A choke line and a kill line are to be properly installed. The kill line is not to be used as a
fill-up line.

The accumulator system shall have a pressure capacity to provide for repeated operation of
hydraulic preventers.

Drill string safety valve(s), to fit all tools in the drill string, are to be maintained on the rig floor
while drilling operations are in progress.

PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM:

The proposed casing and cementing program shall be conducted as approved to protect
and/or isolate all usable water zones, potentially productive zones, lost circulation zones,
abnormally pressured zones, and any prospectively valuable deposits of minerals. Any
isolating medium other than cement shall receive approval prior to use. The casing setting
depth shall be calculated to position the casing seat opposite a competent formation which
will contain the maximum pressure to which it will be exposed during normal drilling
operations. Determination of casing setting depth shall be based on all relevant factors,
including; presence/absence of hydrocarbons; fracture gradients; usable water zones;
formation pressures; lost circulation zones; other minerals; or other unusual characteristics.
All indications of usable water shall be reported.




ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 VONFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal #14-4-11-17 Lease No. UTU-76032

856' FSL and 752' FWL

SW SW Section 4, T11S - R17E DRILLING PROGRAM

Duchesne County, Utah Page 4
b. Casing design shall assume formation pressure gradients of 0.44 to 0.50 psi per foot for

exploratory wells (lacking better data).

C. Casing design shall assume fracture gradients from 0.70 to 1.00 psi per foot for exploratory
wells (lacking better data)

d. Casing collars shall have a minimum clearance of 0.422 inches of all sides in the hole/casing
annulus, with recognition that variances can be granted for justified exceptions.

e. All waiting on cement times shall be adequate to achieve a minimum of 500 psi compressive
strength at the casing shoe prior to drilling out.

f. All casing except the conductor casing, shall be new or reconditioned and tested used casing
that meets or exceeds API standards for new casing.

g. The surface casing shall be cemented back to surface either during the primary cement job
or by remedial cementing.

h. All indications of usable water shall be reported to the authorized officer prior to running the
next string of casing or before plugging orders are requested, whichever occurs first.

i. Three centralizers will be run on the bottom three joints of surface casing with a minimum of
one centralizer per joint starting with the shoe joint.

J- Top plugs shall be used to reduce contamination of cement by displacement fluid. A bottom
plug or other acceptable technique, such as a suitable preflush fluid, inner string cement
method, etc. shall be utilized to help isolate the cement from contamination by the mud fluid
being displaced ahead of the cement slurry.

k. All casing strings below the conductor shall be pressure tested to 0.22 psi per foot of casing
string length or 1500 psi, whichever is greater, but not to exceed 70 percent of the minimum
internal yield. If pressure declines more than 10 percentin 30 minutes, corrective action shall
be taken.

On all exploratory wells, and on that portion of any well approved for a 5M BOPE system or
greater, a pressure integrity test of each casing shoe shall be performed. Formation at the
shoe shall be tested to a minimum of the mud weight equivalent anticipated to control the
formation pressure to the next casing depth or at total depth of the well. This test shall be

oM l’E%'

‘N,

performed before drilling more than 20 feet of new hole.

PERMITC(
NCoypaxs”



ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 LUNFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company
Wilkin Ridge Federal #14-4-11-17

856' FSL and 752' FWL

Lease No. UTU-76032

SW SW Section 4, T11S - R17E DRILLING PROGRAM
Duchesne County, Utah Page 5
m. The proposed casing program will be as follows:
Purpose Depth Hole Size | 0.D. Weight | Grade | Type New/Used
Conductor 0-200' 17-1/2" 13-3/8" 48# H-40 New
Surface 0-3,345' 12-1/4" 8-5/8" 32# J-55 ST&C New
Production 0-12,580' 7-7/8" 4-1/2" 13.5# P-110 | LT&C New
n. Casing design subject to revision based on geologic conditions encountered.
0. The cement program will be as follows:
Conductor Type and Amount

TOC @ Surface 200 sx Premium Type 5 mixed @ 15.6 ppg, 1.18 yield

Type and Amount

Lead: 552 sx Hi-Lift mixed @ 11 ppg, 3.91 yield
Tail: 185 sx 10-2 RFC mixed @ 14.2 ppg, 1.63 yield

Surface

TOC @ Surface

Production Type and Amount
TOC @ 2,500' Lead: 523 sx Hi-Lift mixed @ 11.5 ppg, 3.05 yield
Tail: 1230 sx 50:50 Poz mixed @ 14.1 ppg, 1.28 yield
p. Anticipated cement tops will be reported as to depth; not the expected number of sacks of

cement to be used. The District Office should be notified, with sufficient lead time, in order
to have a BLM representative on location while running all casing strings and cementing.

q. After cementing but before commencing any test, the casing string shall stand cemented until
the cement has reached a compressive strength of at least 500 psi at the shoe. WOC time
shall be recorded in the driller's log.

r. The following reports shall be filed with the District Manager within 30 days after the work is
completed.




ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 LONFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal #14-4-11-17 Lease No. UTU-76032
856' FSL and 752' FWL

SW SW Section 4, T11S - R17E DRILLING PROGRAM
Duchesne County, Utah Page 6

1. Progress reports, Form 3160-5 (formerly 9-331) "Sundry Notices and Reports on
Wells", must include complete information concerning:

a. Setting of each string of casing, showing the size, grade, weight of casing
set, hole size, setting depth, amounts and type of cement used, whether
cement circulated or the top of the cement behind the casing, depth of
cementing tools used, casing test method and results, and the date work
was done. Show the spud date on the first reports submitted.

b. Temperature or bond logs must be submitted for each well where the casing
cement was not circulated to the surface.

S. Auxiliary equipment to be used is as follows:
1. Kelly cock
2. No bit float is deemed necessary.
3. A sub with a full opening valve.

5. MUD PROGRAM

a. The proposed circulating mediums to be employed in drilling are as follows:
Interval Mud Type Mud Wt. Visc. F/L pH
0 - 200' Fresh Water 8.33 1 7
200' - 3,345' Fresh Water 8.33 1 7-8
3,345' - 12,580' Fresh Water/ DAP 9.0-11.5 30-40 12-20 8

There will be sufficient mud on location to control a biowout should one occur.

A mud test shall be performed every 24 hours after mudding up to determine, as applicable:
density, viscosity, gel strength, static filtration loss, and Ph.

<«

ERMITC(
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 ONSHORE ORDERNO. 1 LUNFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal #14-4-11-17 Lease No. UTU-76032

856' FSL and 752' FWL

SW SW Section 4, T11S - R17E DRILLING PROGRAM

Duchesne County, Utah Page 7
b. Mud monitoring equipment to be used is as follows:

1. Periodic checks will be made each tour of the mud system. The mud level will be
checked visually.

No chromate additives will be used in the mud system on Federal and/or Indian lands without
prior BLM approval to ensure adequate protection of fresh water aquifers.

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA Title Il in an amount equal to or greater than
10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in
association with the drilling of this well. Furthermore, no extremely hazardous substances,
as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities, will be used, produced, stored,
transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling of this well.

The use of materials under BLM jurisdiction will conform to 43 CFR 3610.2-3.

6. EVALUATION PROGRAM

The anticipated type and amount of testing, logging and coring are as follows:

a.

No drill stem tests are anticipated, however, if DST's are run, the following requirements will
be adhered to:

Initial opening of drill stem test tools shall be restricted to daylight hours unless specific
approval to start during other hours is obtained from the authorized officer. However, DST's
may be allowed to continue at night if the test was initiated during daylight hours and the rate
of flow is stabilized and if adequate lighting is available (i.e. lighting which is adequate for
visibility and vapor-proof for safe operations). Packers can be released, but tripping shall not
begin before daylight, unless prior approval is obtained from the authorized officer. Closed
chamber DSTs may be accomplished day or night.

A DST that flows to the surface with evidence of hydrocarbons shall be either reversed out
of the testing string under controlled surface conditions. This would involve provided some
means for reverse circulation.

Separation equipment required for the anticipated recovery shall be properly installed before
a test starts.




ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 LUNFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal #14-4-11-17 Lease No. UTU-76032
856' FSL and 752' FWL

SW SW Section 4, T11S - R17E DRILLING PROGRAM
Duchesne County, Utah Page 8

All engines within 100 feet of the wellbore that are required to "run" during the test shall have
spark arresters or water cooled exhausts.

The logging program will consist of a Schlumberger Platform Express to be run from T.D. to
Base of Surface Casing.

No cores are anticipated.

Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well Completion and
Recompletion Report and Log" (Form 3160-4) will be submitted not later than 30 days after
completion of the well or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance with
43 CFR 3164. Two copies of all logs, core descriptions, core analyses, well-test data,
geologic summaries, sample description, and all other surveys or data obtained and compiled
during the drilling, workover, and/or completion operations, will be filed with form 3160-4.
Samples (cutting, fluids, and/or gases0 will be submitted when requested by the authorized
officer (AO).

The anticipated completion program will is as follows: Perform multistage fracs and complete
all productive Blackhawk, Mesaverde, and Wasatch zones present in wellbore. Produce all
zones commingled.

Daily drilling and completion progress reports shall be submitted to the BLM in Vernal on a
weekly basis.

7. ABNORMAL TEMPERATURES OR PRESSURES

AN A . Y e —,—,—m

a.

b.

The expected bottom hole pressure is 7548 psi. The maximum bottom hole temperature
anticipated is 226 degrees F.

No Hydrogen Sulfide Gas is anticipated.

8. ANTICIPATED STARTING DATES AND NOTIFICATION OF OPERATIONS

a.

b.

Drilling is planned to commence on upon approval of this application.

It is anticipated that the drilling of this well will take approximately 35 days.

A
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ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CUNFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal #14-4-11-17 Lease No. UTU-76032

856' FSL and 752' FWL

SW SW Section 4, T11S - R17E DRILLING PROGRAM

Duchesne County, Utah Page 9
C. The BLM in Vernal, Utah shall be notified of the anticipated date of location construction

commencement and of anticipated spud date.

No location will be constructed or moved, no well will be plugged, and no drilling or workover
equipment will be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without prior
approval of the AO. If operations are to be suspended, prior approval of the AO will be
obtained and notification given before resumption of operations.

The spud date will be reported orally to the AO within 48 hours after spudding. If the
spudding occurs on a weekend or holiday, the report will be submitted on the following regular
work day. The oral report will be followed up with a Sundry Notice.

In accordance with Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, this well will be reported on Form 31 60-
6 "Monthly Report of Operations”, starting with the month in which operations commence and
continue each month until the well is physically plugged and abandoned. This report will be
filed with the Vernal BLM District Office, 170 South 500 East, Vernal, UT 84078.

Immediate Report: Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents, or any other unusual occurrences
shall be promptly reported in accordance with the requirements of NTL-3A or its revision.

If a replacement rig is contemplated for completion operations, a "Sundry Notice" Form 3160-
5 1o that effect will be filed, for prior approval of the AO, and all conditions of this approved
plan are applicable during all operations conducted with the replacement rig.

Should the well be successfully completed for production, the AO will be notified when the
wellis placed in a producing status. Such notification will be sent by telegram or other written
communications, not later than 5 days following the date on which the well is placed on
production.

Pursuant to Onshore Order No. 7, with the approval of the District Engineer, produced water
may be temporarily disposed of into unlined pits for a period of up to 90 days. During the
period so authorized, an application for approval of the permanent disposal method, along
with the required water analysis and other information, must be submitted to the District
Engineer.
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k.

Pursuant to NTL-4A, lessees or operators are authorized to vent/flare gas during initial well
evaluation tests, not exceeding a period of 30 days or the production of 50 MMCF of gas,
whichever occurs first. An application must be filed with the District Engineer and approval
received, for any venting/flaring of gas beyond the initial 30 day or authorized test period.

A schematic facilities diagram as required by 43 CFR 3162.7-5 (b.9.d.), shall be submitted to
the appropriate District Office within sixty (60) days of installation or first production,
whichever occurs first. All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Order No. 3 shall
be adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will be
effectively sealed in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-5 (b.4.).

A first production conference will be scheduled within 15 days after receipt of the first
production notice.

No well abandonment operations will be commenced without the prior approval of the AO.
In the case of newly drilled dry holes or failures, and in emergency situations, oral approval
will be obtained from the SO. A "Subsequent Report of Abandonment" Form 3160-5, will be
filed with the AO within 30 days following completion of the well for abandonment. This report
will indicate where plugs were placed and the current status of surface restoration. Final
abandonment will not be approved until the surface reclamation work required by the
approved APD or approved abandonment notice has been completed to the satisfaction of
the AO or his representative, or the appropriate Surface Managing Agency.

Pursuant to Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, lessees and operators have the responsibility
to see that their exploration, development, production, and construction operations are
conducted in a manner which conforms with applicable Federal laws and regulations and with
State and local laws and.regulations to the extent that such State and local laws are
applicable to operations on Federal or indian lands.

Phone: 435/781-4400 Vernal, Utah 84078 Fax: 435/781-4410 ||

Bureau of Land Management
170 South 500 East

After Hours:

Matt Baker Petroleum Engineer 435/828-4470

Michael Lee Petroleum Engineer 435/828-7875
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ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Location Construction - forty-eight (48) hours prior to construction of location and access roads.

Location Completion - prior to moving on the drilling rig.

Spud Notice - at least twenty-four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.

Casing String and - twenty-four (24) hours prior to running casing and

Cementing cementing all casing strings.

BOP and Related - twenty-four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests.

Equipment Tests

First Production - within five (5) business days after new well begins or

Notice production resumes after well has been off production for more than
ninety (90) days.

The onsite inspection for the subject well site was conducted on Tuesday, November 1, 2005 at
approximately 3:00 p.m. Weather conditions were clear, cool and breezy. In attendance at the onsite
inspection were the following individuals:

Karl Wright Natural Resource Specialist Bureau of Land Management

Todd Megrath Wildiife Biologist SWCA

Lisa Smith Permitting Agent Permitco Inc.

Jesse Walton Surveyor Uintah Engineering and Land Surveying
Shawn Elworthy Field Supervisor Gasco Production Company

1. EXISTING ROADS

a. The proposed well site is located approximately 27.1 miles south of Myton, Utah.
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b. Directions to the location from Myton, Utah are as follows:

Proceed in a southeasterly direction from Myton, Utah for approximately 12.7 miles to the
Castle Peak Mine. Stay right and continue southerly for 6.6 miles to a fork in the road.
Stay right again and continue southerly 1.5 miles. Continue southerly on the proposed
access road for 0.3 miles until reaching the proposed location.

C. For location of access roads within a 2-Mile radius, see Maps A & B.

d. Improvement to existing main roads will not be required.

e. Al existing roads will be maintained and kept in good repair during all drilling and
completion operations associated with this well.

f. Existing roads and newly constructed roads on surface under the jurisdiction of any
Surface Managing Agency shall be maintained in accordance with the standards of the
SMA.

2. PLANNED ACCESS ROADS

a. There will be 0.3 miles of new access to be constructed.

b. The maximum grade is approximately 3%.

C. No turnouts are planned.

d. No culverts will be necessary. Low water crossings will be installed as deemed necessary
at the time of construction.

e. The access road was centerline surveyed at the time of staking.

f. The use of surfacing material is not anticipated, however it may be necessary depending
on weather conditions.

g. No cattle guards will be necessary.

h. Surface disturbance and vehicular trave! will be limited to the approved location and

approved access route. Any additional area needed will be approved in advance.
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i. Access roads and surface disturbing activities will conform to standards outlined in the
Bureau of Land Management and Forest Service publication: Surface Operating
Standards for Oil and Gas Exploration and Development, (1989).

j- The road will be constructed/upgraded to meet the standards of the anticipated traffic flow
and all weather road requirements. Construction/upgrading shall include ditching,
draining, graveling, crowing and capping the roadbed as necessary to provide a well
constructed safe road. Prior to upgrading, the road shall be cleared of any snow cover
and allowed to dry completely. Traveling off the 30 foot right-of-way will not be allowed.
Road drainage crossings shall be of the typical dry creek drainage crossing type.
Crossings shall be designed so they will not cause siltation or accumulation of debris in
the drainage crossing nor shall the drainages be blocked by the roadbed. Erosion of
drainage ditches by runoff water shall be prevented by diverting water off at frequent
intervals by means of cutouts. Upgrading shall not be allowed during muddy conditions.
Should mud holes develop, they shall be filled in and detours around them avoided.

k. No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA Title il in an amount equal to or greater
than 10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually
in association with the drilling of this well. Furthermore, no extremely hazardous
substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities, will be used,
produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling of this well.

No road right of ways will be necessary since all new access is within the lease boundary.

3. LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHIN A 1-MILE RADIUS OF THE PROPOSED LOCATION.

(See Map “C’)
a. Water wells - none
b. Injection wells - none
C. Producing wells - one
d. Drilling wells - none
e. Shut-in wells - none
f. Temporarily abandoned wells - none A ' ,
& e
g. Disposal wells -none PERI "TC“
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h. Abandoned wells - one

Dry Holes - none

LOCATION OF TANK BATTERIES AND PRODUCTION FACILITIES.

a.

All permanent structures (onsite for six months or longer) constructed or installed
(including oil well pump jacks) will be painted Carlsbad Canyon. Al facilities will be
painted within six months of installation. Facilities required to comply with the
Occupational Safety and Health Act (OSHA) will be excluded.

If storage facilities/tank batteries are constructed on this lease, the facility/battery or the
well pad shall surrounded by a containment dike of sufficient capacity to contain at a
minimum, the entire contents of the largest tank within the facility/battery, unless more
stringent protective requirements are deemed necessary by the authorized officer.

If production is established, a production facility diagram will be submitted via Sundry
Notice.

All loading lines will be placed inside the berm surrounding the tank battery.

Gas meter runs for each well will be located within 500 feet of the wellhead. The gas flow
line will be buried or anchored down from the wellhead to the separator. Meter runs will
be housed and/or fenced.

The oil and gas measurement facilities will be installed on the well location. The oil and
gas meters will be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. Tests for meter accuracy will
be conducted monthly for the first three months on new meter installations and at least
quarterly thereafter. The AO will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter
calibration and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports
will be submitted to the Vernal Field Office. All meter measurement facilities will conform
with Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 4 for liquid hydrocarbons and Onshore Oil and Gas
Order No. 5 for natural gas measurement.
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g. If at any time the facilities located on public land and authorized by the terms of the lease

5.

6.

are no longer included in the lease (due to a contraction in the unit or other lease or unit
boundary change), BLM will process a change in authorization to the appropriate statute.
The authorization will be subject to appropriate rental or other financial obligation as
determined by the authorized officer.

Any necessary pits will be properly fenced to prevent any wildlife entry.

Al site security guidelines identified in 43 CFR 3162.7 regulations will be adhered to.

All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on-lease or off-lease will
have prior written approval from the District Manager.

All access roads will be maintained as necessary to prevent erosion and accommodate
year-round traffic.

The road will be maintained in a safe useable condition.

Produced water will be stored in a 300 bbl heated, insulated tank, then hauled to a
commercial disposal site such as Disposal Inc., or Brennan Bottom.

Pipelines will follow the route shown on Map D. See Pipeline detail attached. No pipeline
right of way will be necessary.

LOCATION AND TYPE OF WATER SUPPLY

a.

The proposed water source will be the Nebecker Water Station in Myton. The Water Use
Claim # is 43-1721.

Water will be hauled by Nebecker Water Service to the location over the access roads
shown on Maps A and B.

No water well will be drilled on this lease.

SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL

a.

b.

Surface and subsoil materials in the immediate area will be utilized.

Any gravel used will be obtained from a commercial source.
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C. The use of materials under BLM jurisdiction will conform with 43 CFR 361 0.2.3.
Construction material will not be located on lease.

d. No construction materials will be removed from Federal land.

7. METHODS OF HANDLING WASTE DISPOSAL

a. The reserve pit will be constructed so as not to leak, break, or allow discha'rge.

b. At the request of the BLM, the reserve pit will be lined with a 12 mil liner. If fractured rock
is encountered, the pit will be first lined with sufficient bedding (either straw or dirt) to
cover any rocks. The liner will overlap the pit walls and be covered with dirt and/or rocks
to hold it in place. No trash, scrap pipe, efc., that could puncture the liner will be disposed
of in the pit. More stringent protective requirements may be deemed necessary by the
A.Q.

C. Burning will not be allowed. All trash will be contained in a trash cage and its contents
removed at the end of drilling operations and hauled to an approved disposal sight.

d. After first production, produced waste water will be confined to a unlined pit or storage
tank for a period not to exceed ninety (90) days. During the 90-day period, in accordance
with Onshore Order No. 7, an application for approval of a permanent disposal method
and location, along with the required water analysis, will be submitted for the AO's
approval. Failure to file an application within the time allowed will be considered an
incident of noncompliance.

e. Drill cuttings are to be contained and buried in the reserve pit.

f. Any salts and/or chemicals which are an integral part of the drilling system will be
disposed of in the same manner as the drilling fluid.

g. A chemical porta-toilet will be furnished with the drilling rig.
h. The produced fluids will be produced into a test tank until such time as construction of

production facilities is completed. Any spills of oil, gas salt water or other produced fluids
will be cleaned up and removed.




ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CONFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal #14-4-11-17 Lease No. UTU-76032
856' FSL and 752' FWL

SW SW Section 4, T11S - R17E SURFACE USE PLAN
Duchesne County, Utah Page 7
8. ANCILLARY FACILITIES

There are no airstrips, camps, or other facilities planned during the drilling of the proposed well.

WELL SITE LAYOUT

a.

The operator or his/her contractor shall contact the BLM Office at 435/781-4400 forty-
eight (48) hours prior to construction activities.

The reserve pit will be located on the northwest side of the location.

The flare pit will be located on the north side of the reserve pit, a minimum of 100 feet
from the well head and 30 feet from the reserve pit fence.

The stockpiled topsail (first six inches) will be stored on the northeast side of the location,
around Corner 9. Topsoil along the access route will be wind rowed on the uphill side.

Access to the well pad will be from the north as shown on the Pit & Pad Layout.
See Location Layout for orientation of rig, cross section of drill pad and cuts and fills.

The location of mud tanks; reserve pit, trash cage; pipe racks; living facilities and soil
stockpiles will be shown on the Location Layout.

Al pits will be fenced according to the following minimum standards:
1. 39 inch net wire shall be used with at least one strand or barbed wire on top of

the net wire (barbed wire is not necessary if pipe or some type of reinforcement
rod is attached to the top of the entire fence).

2. The net wire shall be no more than 2-inches above the ground. The barbed wire
shall be 3-inches above the net wire. Total height of the fence shall be at least
42-inches.

3. Comer posts shall be cemented and/or braced in such a manner to keep the

fence tight at all times.
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4. Standard steel, wood, or pipe posts shall be used between the comer braces.

Maximum distance between any two posts shall be no greater than 16 feet.

5. All wire shall be stretched, by using a stretching device, before it is attached to
the corner posts.

The reserve pit fencing will be on three sides during drilling operations and on the fourth
side when the rig moves off the location. Pits will be fenced and maintained until cleanup.

10. PLANS FOR RESTORATION OF SURFACE

Producing Location

a.

Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area will be cleared of all
unused tubing, equipment, debris, materials, trash and junk not required for production.

Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons on the pit shall be removed in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-1.

If a plastic nylon reinforced liner is used it shall be torn and perforated before backfilling of
the reserve pit.

The reserve pit and that portion of the location not needed for production facilities or
operations will be recontoured to the approximate natural contours. The reserve pit will be
reclaimed within 120 days from the date of well completion. Before any dirt work takes
place, the reserve pit must have all fluids and hydrocarbons removed and all cans,
barrels, pipe, etc., will be removed.

Reclamation of unused disturbed areas on the well pad/access road no longer needed for
operations, such as cut slopes, and fill areas will be accomplished by grading, leveling
and seeding as recommended by the Authorized Officer. The following seed mixture has
been requested by the Bureau of Land Management.

Species Pounds PLS/Acres
Indian Ricegrass 4
High Crested Wheatgrass 4
Needlegrass 4
Threadgrass 4
TOTAL 12
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Seeding will be performed immediately after the location has been reclaimed and the pit
has been backfilled, regardiess of the time of year. Seed will be broadcast and walked in
with a dozer.

The topsoil stockpile will be seeded as soon as the location has been constructed with the
same recommended seed mix. The seed will be walked in with a cat.

Dry Hole

g.

At such time as the well is plugged and abandoned, the operator shall submit a
subsequent report of abandonment and BLM will attach the appropriate surface
rehabilitation conditions of approval.

Interim Surface Reclamation will be as follows:

1.

Immediately after final well completion, the location and surrounding area will be cleared
of all unused tubing, materials, trash, and debris not required for production operations.

Before any dirt work associated with location restoration takes place, the reserve pit shall
be as dry as possible. All debris in the reserve pit will be removed. Other waste and spoil
materials will be disposed of immediately, weather permitting, upon final well completion.

If a synthetic, nylon re-enforced, liner is used, the excess liner will be cut off and removed
and the remaining liner will be torn and perforated while backfilling the reserve pit.
Alternatively, the pit will be pumped dry, the liner folded into the pit, and the pit backfilled.
The liner will be buried to a minimum of four (4) feet deep.

The reserve pit will be reclaimed within 180 days from the date of final well completion,
weather permitting.

The reserve pit and that portion of the location not needed for production and storage
facilities, and everyday production operations, will be reshaped to the approximate original
contours to the extent possible. This will be completed by backfilling and crowning the pit
to prevent water from standing. Topsoil will be re-spread up to the rig anchor points,
excluding the area needed for production and storage facilities and everyday production
operations. Re-seeding, using appropriate reclamation methods, will occur immediately
following the re-spreading of topsoil, weather permitting. The Authorized Officer will
provide a seed mixture to re-vegetate the reserve pit and other unused disturbed ar
the time of the onsite.
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1. SURFACE OWNERSHIP

Access Roads - The majority of the access roads are maintained by the County Road Department
or the Bureau of Land Management.

Well pad - The well pad is located on lands managed by the BLM.

12. OTHER INFORMATION

a.  AClass !l archeological survey has been conducted by Grand River Institute. A copy of
this report will be submitted to the appropriate agencies by Grand River Institute.

b. The operator is responsible for informing all persons in the areas who are associated with
this project that they will be subject to prosecution for knowingly disturbing historic or
archaeological sites, or for collecting artifacts. If historic or archaeological materials are
uncovered during construction, the operator is to immediately stop work that might further
disturb such materials, and contact the authorized officer (AO). Within five working days
the AO will inform the operator as to:

-whether the materials appear eligible for the National Register of Historic Places;

-the mitigation measures the operator will likely have to undertake before the site can be
used (assuming in situ preservation is not necessary); and

-a time frame for the AO to complete and expedited review under 36 CFR 800.11 to
confirm, through the State Historic Preservation Officer, that the findings of the AO are
correct and that mitigation is appropriate. If the operator wishes, at any time, to relocate
activities to avoid the expense of mitigation and/or the delays associated with this
process, the AO will assume responsibility for whatever recordation and stabilization of
the exposed materials may be required. Otherwise, the operator will be responsible for
mitigation costs. The AO will provide technical and procedural guidelines for the conduct
of mitigation. Upon verification from the AQ that required mitigation has been completed,
the operator will then be allowed to resume construction.

C. The operator will control noxious weeds along rights-of-way for roads, pipelines, well sites,
or other applicable faciiities. A list of noxious weeds may be obtained from the BLM, or




ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CONFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal #14-4-11-17 Lease No. UTU-76032
856' FSL and 752' FWL

SW SW Section 4, T11S - R17E SURFACE USE PLAN
Duchesne County, Utah Page 11

the appropriate County Extension Office. On BLM administered land it is required that a
Pesticide Use Proposal shall be submitted, and given approval, prior to the application of
herbicides or other pesticides or possible hazardous chemicals.

d. Drilling rigs and/or equipment used during drilling operations on this wellsite will not be
stacked or stored on Federal Lands after the conclusion of drilling operations or at any
other time without BLM authorization. However, if BLM authorization is obtained, it is only
a temporary measure.

e. All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is
made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil and Gas Orders, the approved
plan of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees. The operator is fully
responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be
furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

f. A complete copy of the approved APD shall be on location during construction of the
location and drilling activities.

g There will be no deviation from the proposed driling and/or workover program without
prior approval from the AO. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. All
wells, whether drilling, producing, suspended or abandoned will be identified in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.

h. "Sundry Notice and Report on Wells* (Form 3160-5) will be filed for approval for all
changes of plans and other operations in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.3-2.

i This permit will be valid for a period of one year from the date of approval. An extension
period may be granted, if requested, prior to the expiration of the original approval period.
After permit termination, a new application will be filed for approval for any future
operations.

j- The operator or his contractor shall contact the BLM Offices at 435/781-4400 48 hours
prior to construction activities.

k. The BLM Office shall be notified upon site completion prior to moving on the drilling rig.
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13. LESSEE'S OR OPERATOR'S REPRESENTATIVE AND CERTIFICATION

Permit Matters Drilling & Completion Matters
PERMITCO INC. Gasco Production Company
14421 County Road 10 8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100
Ft. Lupton, CO 80621 Englewood, CO 80112
303/857-9999 (O) John Longwell
303/857-0577 (F) 303/483-0044 (O)
Lisa Smith 303/ 483-0011(F)

Shawn Elworthy

Roosevelt, UT
(Cell) 435-823-4272

CERTIFICATION

| hereby certify that I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the proposed drill
site and access route; that | am familiar with the conditions which presently exist; that the
statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and correct; and, that the
work associated with the operations proposed herein will be performed by Gasco Production
Company and its contractors and subcontractors in conformity with the plan and the terms and
conditions under which it is approved.

This statement is subject to the provisions of 18.U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

November 14, 2005 \YU\MVJ(X 60\(144\&7 DO ML |
Date: Venessa Langmacher - PERMITCOINC. !
Authorized Agent for:
Gasco Production Company
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11.

12.
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14.

15.

16.

PIPELINE INFORMATION

Wilkin Ridge Federal #14-4-11-17
The type of pipeline is a single well flow line.
The outside diameter (O.D.) of all will be 8 inches maximum.
The anticipated production through the line is approximately 2000 MCF per day.
The anticipated maximum test pressure is 1000 psi.
The anticipated operating pressure is 100-200 psi.
The type of pipe is steel.
The method of coupling is welded.

The pipeline will be laid on surface because of the extremely rocky surface. The pipeline will be buried
through any wide drainage crossings.

There are no other pipelines to be associated in same right of way.

There will be other objects to be associated in the same right of way. (Risers, Pig Launchers Pig
Traps, meters and other appurtenances as required.)

The total length of pipeline is approximately 10,980 feet - see Map D.

The line will be laid on surface as shown on Map D. Where possible, the pipeline will foliow existing
or proposed roads.

The construction width for total surface disturbing activities is 30 feet.
The estimated total acreage involving all surface disturbing activities is 7.56 acres.

Any surface disturbance created as a result of the pipeline construction will be reclaimed utilizing the
reclamation procedures and seed mixture specified by the Bureau of Land Management.

The line will be tested with gas pressure to 1000 psi.
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FEDERAL STIPULATIONS

Any federal stipulations which apply to this lease will be attached as a condition of approval by the BLM.




Archeology

A Class Ill Archeological Survey has been conducted by Grand River Institute. A copy of this report will be
submitted directly to the appropriate agencies by Grand River Institute.

Botany

A field inspection for Special Status Plant Species has been conducted by SWCA, Inc.

Paleontology

A field inspection for paleontological resources was conducted by Alden Hamblin on 10/26/05.
No mitigation is recommended.




Bureau of Land Management
vernal Field Office

170 S. 500 E.

Vernal, UT 84078

Attn, Minerals

Re: Al Wells
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlernen:

This letter is to inform you that Permitco Inc. is authorized to act as Agent and to sign
documents on behalf of Gasco Production Company, a wholly owned subsidiary of Gasco
Energy, Inc. when necessary for filing county, state and federal permits including Onshore
Order No. 1, Right of Way applications, etc., for the above mentioned well.

it should be understood that Permitco is acting as Agent only in those matters stated
abnve and is not responsible for drilling, completion, production or compliance with
rajulations.

Gasco Production Company agrees to accept full responsibility for operations conducted in
order to drill, complete and produce the above-mentioned well.
//

‘\’cz.%,:yery tr;i)/, e /

Mark J. Choury /‘/ e ' f}/
‘ /

Land Manager v 4

61 500 Erergy. Inc.
4 irveriass Jrve East, Sure H-236 Tel: {303} 483-004¢ Irailt  invast@gasccenargy.com
irslowsor, CO B0°12-5528 Fax. 1303} 483-0011 Website: www.gascoera gy.cem OTCBE GALE



WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 03/17/2006

API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-013-33099

WELL NAME : WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17
OPERATOR : GASCO PRODUCTION ( N2575 ) PHONE NUMBER: 303-857-9999S
CONTACT : VENESSA LANGMACHER
PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
SWSW 04 1108 1708 Tech Review Initials Date
SURFACE : 0856 FSL 0752 FWL
BOTTOM: 0856 FSL 0752 FWL Engineering
COUNTY : DUCHESNE
Geology
LATITUDE: 39.88114 LONGITUDE: -110.0230
UTM SURF EASTINGS: 583542 NORTHINGS: 4414812 Surface
FIELD NAME: WILDCAT ( 1 )
LEASE TYPE: 1l - Federal
LEASE NUMBER: UTU-76032 PROPOSED FORMATION: BLKHK
SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal COALBED METHANE WELL? NO
RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:
/ Plat R649-2-3.
(No. UT-1233 )
]Q, Potash (Y/N) \V R649-3-2. General
!] 0il Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Sltlng: 460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells
v Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception
‘ (No. 43-1721 ) o '
o . Drilling Unit
RDCC Review (Y/N) -
Board Cause No:
(Date: )
_ Eff Date:
Pﬂu Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:
L .
#‘ Intent to Commingle (Y/N) R649-3-11. Directional Drill
COMMENTS :
STIPULATIONS : T (L/\ fL(,n w/

2 @:}&Gn('&§¥
«J
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WILKIN RIDGF $1
24-32-10-17 WILKIN RIDGE ST

44321017 ®

T10S R17E

Ti1S R17E

WILKIN RIDGE
35-05

WILKIN RIDGE
FED 12-4-11-17

WILKIN RIDGE (DEEP) UNIT

WILKIN RIDGE
FED (4-4-11-17

®

® TWIN KNOLLS 59 ]

% BHL
59]

OPERATOR: GASCO PROD CO (N2575)

T.11S R.17E

FIELD: WILDCAT (001)

COUNTY: DUCHESNE

SPACING: R649-3-2 / GENERAL SITING

Field Status
] ABANDONED
] ACTIVE
COMBINED
(= | INACTIVE
1 PROPOSED
STORAGE
| TERMINATED

Unit Status
EXPLORATORY
GAS STORAGE
NE PP OIL
NF SECONDARY

[ |PENDING

3 pIOIL

[ PP GAS
PP GEOTHERML

3 PPOIL

] SECONDARY

| TERMINATED

Wells Status

Mg @D ORI OHOOX 1™

GAS INJECTION

GAS STORAGE
LOCATION ABANDONED
NEW LOCATION
PLUGGED & ABANDONED
PRODUCING GAS
PRODUCING OIL
SHUT-IN GAS

SHUT-IN OIL

TEMP. ABANDONED
TEST WELL

WATER INJECTION
WATER SUPPLY

WATER DISPOSAL
DRILLING

¥ ¥ A\

.
T e
— —
Utah Oil Gas and Mining
W I

PREPARED BY: DIANA WHITNEY
DATE: 20-MARCH-2006




State of Utah

Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAEL R. STYLER
Executive Director
Division of
Oil, Gas & Mining

JOHN R. BAZA
Division Director

JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
Governor

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

April 20, 2006

Gasco Production Company
8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100
Englewood, CO 80112

Re: Wilkin Ridge Federal 14-4-11-17 Well, 856’ FSL, 752° FWL, SW SW, Sec. 4,
T. 11 South, R. 17 East, Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et seq.,
Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval,
approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-013-33099.

Sincerely,
Gil Hunt
Associate Director
mf
Enclosures
cc: Duchesne County Assessor

Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 » facsimile (801) 359-3940 « TTY (801) 538-7458 « wuwogm.utah.gov



Operator: Gasco Production Company

Well Name & Number Wilkin Ridge Federal 14-4-11-17

API Number: 43-013-33099

Lease: UTU-76032

Location: SW SW Sec. 4 T. 11 South R. 17 East
Conditions of Approval

1. General

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Qil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements

|98

4.

w

Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
. Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
. Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

. Reporting Requirements

All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be

obtained prior to drilling.

. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have

not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the “Board”).
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.
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" Form 3160-3 4 o
(August 1999) S
UNITED STATES b

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

NOV 17 2005

FORM APPROVED
OMB No. 1004-0136
Expires November 30, 2000

5. Lease Serial No.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT |1/ UTU-76032
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER P e o Rane
la. Type of Work:m DRILL D REENTER = ‘ I ~‘V7. If Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.
Wilkin Ridge

m Gas Well D Other

b. Type of Well: [_] 0il well

m Single Zone D Multiple Zone

8. Lease Name and Well No.
Wilkin Ridge Federal #14-4-11-17

2. Name of Operator 303-483-0044

Gasco Production Company Englewood, CO 80112

8 Inverness Drive East, Suite #100

9. API Well No.

42 p)%r Z5AT

303-857-9999 14421 County Road 10

3. Name of Agent

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

Permitco Inc. - Agent Fort Lupton, CO 80621 Wilkin Ridge
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) 11. Sec, T, R., M,, or Blk, and Survey or Area
At surface 856' FSL and 752' FWL Section 4, T11S-R17E
At proposed prod. zone SWsSw
14, Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. C or Parish 13. State
. . Bihesne
Approximately 27.1 miles southeast of Myton, UT. Uinteh uT

T3 Distance from proposed™®

| 16. No. of Acres in lease
location to nearest

17. Spacing Unit dedicated to this well

roperty or lease line, ft. =~ 759"
FA]so to nearest drig. unit line, if any) 797.12 40 Acres: SW SW
‘' ’

T8 Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file

to nﬁaa@? well, l;i.nlllmg, c;)mpleted,

applied for, on thislease, ft None 12.580"

’ Bond No. UT-1233
21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22. Approximate date work will start* 23. Estimated duration
6393 GL ASAP 35 Days

24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1,

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4.
2. A Drilling Plan.

shall be attached to this form:

Bond tg cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, 1 5. Opm')r ‘éﬁ i M.'ISIOH Of
shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office. . ther site's i d/or plans as may be required by the
SUPO shall be filed with th iate F' Service Offi 6 % aspﬁﬂd 1 p y q y

18€]

CONFIDENTIAL-TIGHT HOLE

RECORD ONLy

25y Signature | Name (Printed/Typed) i Date
WAL BANL AWYV\&ULM | _ Venessa Langmacher ' 11/14/2005
Title * 4AN
Authorized Agent for Gasco Production Company i s
Approved by (Signature) | Name (Printed/Typed) sV Eli.bate
» W : Tty flewepia acTne ')ggs'r G-25-2006
Title / / / JOffice AL

Leistant Field Manager |
H &

DIVOF Qi GAS & MINING

Application approval does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to

conduct operations thereon.

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the
United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*(Instructions on reverse)

NOTICE OF APPROVAL




UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
VERNAL FIELD OFFICE
170 South 500 East VERNAL, UT 84078 (435) 781-4400

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company: Gasco Production Company Location: SWSW, Sec 4, T11S, R17E
Well No: Wilkin Ridge Federal 14-4-11-17 Lease No: UTU-76032

API No: 43-013-33099 Agreement: Wilkin Ridge (Deep) Unit
Petroleum Engineer: Matt Baker Office: 435-781-4490 Cell: 435-828-4470
Petroleum Engineer: Michael Lee Office: 435-781-4432 Cell: 435-828-7875
Supervisory Petroleum Technician: Jamie Sparger Office: 435-781-4502 Cell: 435-828-3913
Environmental Scientist: Paul Buhler Office: 435-781-4475 Cell: 435-828-4029
Environmental Scientist: Karl Wright Office: 435-781-4484

Natural Resource Specialist: Holly Villa Office: 435-781-4404

Natural Resource Specialist: Melissa Hawk Office: 435-781-4476

Natural Resource Specialist: Scoftt Ackerman Office: 435-781-4437

After Hours Contact Number: 435-781-4513 Fax: 435-781-4410

A COPY OF THESE CONDITIONS SHALL BE FURNISHED TO YOUR
FIELD REPRESENTATIVE TO INSURE COMPLIANCE

All lease and/or unit operations are to be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made with
the applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR Part 3160), and this approved Application for Permit to Drill
including Surface and Downhole Conditions of Approval. The operator is considered fully responsible
for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy of the approved APD must be on location during
construction, drilling, and completion operations. This permit is approved for a one-year period. An
additional year extension may be applied for by sundry notice prior to expiration.

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Location Construction - Forty-Eight (48) hours prior to construction of location
(Notify Karl Wright) and access roads.
Location Completion - Prior to moving on the drilling rig.

(Notify Karl Wright)

Spud Notice - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.
(Notify Petroleum Engineer) :

Casing String & Cementing - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to running casing and
(Notify Jamie Sparger) cementing all casing strings

BOP & Related Equipment Tests - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests
(Notify Jamie Sparger)

First Production Notice - Within Five (5) business days after new well begins or
(Notify Petroleum Engineer) production resumes after well has been off production for

more than ninety (90) days
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Well: Wilkin Ridge Federal 14-4-10-17
9/28/2006

SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

All applicable Iocal, state, and/or federal laws, regulations, and/or statutes must be complied
with.

Construction related traffic shall be restricted to approved routes. Cross-country vehicle travel
will not be allowed.

If additional erosion occurs during the life of this project, more culverts, low water crossings,
berms, wing ditches or etc. will be needed to control the erosion.

The reserve pit will be lined with a 16 ml or greater liner.

No vehicle travel, construction or routine maintenance activities shall be performed during
periods when the soil is too wet to adequately support vehicles and/or construction equipment. If
such equipment creates ruts in excess of four inches deep, the soil shall be deemed too wet to
adequately support construction equipment.

The liner is to be cut at the level of the cuttings or treated to prevent the reemergence of the pit
liner and pit material to the surface or its interference with long-term successful re-vegetation.
Any excess liner material removed from the pit is to be disposed of at an authorized disposal
site.

When the reserve pit contains fluids or toxic substances, the operator must ensure that animals
do not ingest or become entrapped in pit fluids.

Frac-fluids are not allowed in the reserve pit.

Drill cuttings and mud will remain in the reserve pit until DRY. The reserve pit must be free of oil
and other liquid and solid wastes, allowed to dry, be pumped dry, or solidified in-situ prior to
filing. The reserve pit will not be “squeezed,” (filled with soil while still containing fluids) or “cut”
(puncturing the pit liner while still containing fluids to allow pit fluids to drain from the pit).

Prevent fill and stock piles from entering drainages.

CULTURAL AND PALEONTOLOGICAL RESOURCES - Any cultural and/or paleontological
resource (historic or prehistoric site or object or fossil) discovered by the holder, or any person
working on his behalf, on public or Federal land shall be immediately reported to the authorized
officer. Holder shall suspend all operations in the immediate area of such discovery until written
authorization to proceed is issued by the authorized officer. An evaluation of the discovery will
be made by the authorized officer to determine appropriate actions to prevent the loss of
significant cultural or scientific values. The holder will be responsible for the cost of evaluation
and a decision as to proper mitigation measures shall be made by the authorized officer after
consulting with the holder. ‘

The access road will be crowned and ditched. Flat-bladed roads are NOT aliowed.

Notify the Authorized Officer 48 hours prior to surface disturbing activities.
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Well: Wilkin Ridge Federal 14-4-10-17
9/28/2006

All well facilities not regulated by OSHA will be painted Carlsbad Canyon.
The boulders >3’ found at the surface or above ground will be saved for final reclamation.

Trees must be removed from the location must be piled separately off location and saved for
final reclamation purposes. '

Interim Reclamation (see below):
Where possible, strip six inches of topsoil from the location as shown on the cut sheet. After the
well is converted to an injection well, the topsoil will be spread and re-contoured on the location

and immediately seeded with the seed mix below.

Interim Reclamation Seed Mix for location:

Galleta grass Hilaria jamesil 6 Ibs/acre
Western wheatgrass Pascopyrum smithii 6 Ibs/acre
Per Live Seed Total 12 Ibs/acre

The topsoil from the reserve pit shall be stripped and piled separately near the reserve pit.
When the reserve pit is closed it shall be re-contoured, then the area shall be seeded in the
same manner as the topsoil.

There shall be no primary or secondary noxious weeds in the seed mixture.

Once the location is plugged and abandoned contact the Authorized Officer for final rectamation
plans.

The above listed seed mix shall be used to seed all unused portions of the pad including the
topsoil and stock piles, and the reserve pits. Re-seeding may be required if the first seeding is
not successful.

The seed shall be drilled or disked into the ground or hand broadcast onto the ground. Planting
depth shall not exceed one-half inch using a seed drill. If the seed is hand broadcast then the
seed mixture will be doubled and the area raked or chained to cover the seed.
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DOWNHOLE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

All provisions outlined in Onshore Oil & Gas Order #2 Drilling Operations shall be strictly
adhered to. The following items are emphasized:

SITE SPECIFIC DOWNHOLE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

None

DRILLING/COMPLETION/PRODUCING OPERATING STANDARDS

There shall be no deviation from the proposed drilling, completion, and/or workover program as
approved. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. All wells, whether drilling,
producing, suspended, or abandoned, shall be identified in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.6.
There shall be a sign or marker with the name of the operator, lease serial number, well
number, and surveyed description of the well. Any changes in operation must have prior
approval from the BLM, Vernal Field Office Petroleum Engineers.

The spud date and time shall be reported orally to Vernal Field Office within 24 hours of
spudding.

Notify Vernal Field Office Supervisory Petroleum Engineering Technician at least 24
hours in advance of casing cementing operations and BOPE & casing pressure tests.

Blowout prevention equipment (BOPE) shall remain in use until the well is completed or
abandoned. Closing unit controls shall remain unobstructed and readily accessible at all times.
Choke manifolds shall be located outside of the rig substructure.

All BOPE components shall be inspected daily and those inspections shall be recorded in the
daily drilling report. Components shall be operated and tested as required by Onshore Oil &
Gas Order No. 2 to insure good mechanical working order. All BOPE pressure tests shall be
performed by a test pump with a chart recorder and NOT by the rig pumps. Test shall be
reported in the driller’s log.

BOP drills shall be initially conducted by each drilling crew within 24 hours of drilling out from
under the surface casing and weekly thereafter as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 2.

Casing pressure tests are required before drilling out from under all casing strings set and
cemented in place.

No aggressive/fresh hard-banded drill pipe shall be used within casing.

All shows of fresh water and minerals shall be reported and protected. A sample shall be taken
of any water flows and a water analysis furnished the BLM, Vernal Field Office. All oil and gas
shows shall be adequately tested for commercial possibilities, reported, and protected.

No location shall be constructed or moved, no well shall be plugged, and no drilling or workover
equipment shall be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without prior
approval of the BLM, Vernal Field Office. If operations are to be suspended for more than 30
days, prior approval of the BLM, Vernal Field Office shall be obtained and notification given
before resumption of operations.
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Chronologic drilling progress reports shall be filed directly with the BLM, Vernal Field Office on a
weekly basis in sundry, letter format or e-mail to the Petroleum Engineers until the well is
completed.

Any change in the program shall be approved by the BLM, Vernal Field Office. "Sundry Notices
and Reports on Wells" (Form BLM 3160-5) shali be filed for all changes of plans and other
operations in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.3-2.

Emergency approval may be obtained orally, but such approval does not waive the written
report requirement. Any additional construction, reconstruction, or alterations of facilities,
including roads, gathering lines, batteries, etc., which will result in the disturbance of new
ground, shall require the filing of a suitable plan pursuant to Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 1 of
43 CFR 3164.1 and prior approval by the BLM, Vernal Field Office.

In accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-3, this well shall be reported on the "“Monthly Report of
Operations" (Oil and Gas Operations Report ((OGOR)) starting with the month in which
operations commence and continue each month until the well is physically plugged and
abandoned. This report shall be filed in duplicate, directly with the Minerals Management
Service, P.O. Box 17110, Denver, Colorado 80217-0110, or call 1-800-525-7922 (303) 231-
3650 for reporting information.

Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, “"Well Completion and
Recompletion Report and Log" (BLM Form 3160-4) shall be submitted not later than 30 days
after completion of the well or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.4-1. Two copies of all logs run, core descriptions, and all other surveys or
data obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover, and/or completion operations, shall be
filed on BLM Form 3160-4. Submit with the well completion report a geologic report including,
at a minimum, formation tops, and a summary and conclusions. Also include deviation surveys,
sample descriptions, strip logs, core data, drill stem test data, and results of production tests if
performed. Samples (cuttings, fluid, and/or gas) shall be submitted only when requested by the
BLM, Vernal Field Office.

A cement bond log (CBL) will be run from the production casing shoe to the surface casing shoe
and shall be utilized to determine the bond quality for the production casing. Submit a field copy
of the CBL to this office.

Please submit an electronic copy of all other logs run on this well in LAS format to
UT_VN_Welllogs@BLM.gov. This submission will supersede the requirement for
submittal of paper logs to the BLM.

All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on-lease or off-lease shall have
prior written approval from the BLM, Vernal Field Office.

All measurement points shall be identified as point of sales or allocation for royalty
determination prior to the installation of facilities.

Oil and gas meters shall be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. The Field Office
Petroleum Engineers will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter calibration and all
future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports shall be submitted to
the BLM, Vernal Field Office. All measurement facilities will conform to the API standards for
liquid hydrocarbons and the AGA standards for natural gas measurement.
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A schematic facilities diagram as required by Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be submitted
to the BLM, Vernal Field Office within 30 days of installation or first production, whichever
occurs first. All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be
adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will be effectively
sealed in accordance with Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3.

This APD is approved subject to the requirement that, should the well be successfully
completed for production, the BLM, Vernal Field office must be notified when it is placed in a
producing status. Such notification will be by written communication and must be received in
this office by not later than the fifth business day following the date on which the well is placed
on production. The notification shall provide, as a minimum, the following informational items:

Operator name, address, and telephone number.

Well name and number.

Well location (%%, Sec., Twn, Rng, and P.M.).

Date well was placed in a producing status (date of first production for which

royalty will be paid).

The nature of the well's production, (i.e., crude oil, or crude oil and casing head

gas, or natural gas and entrained liquid hydrocarbons).

o The Federal or Indian lease prefix and number on which the well is located,;
otherwise the non-Federal or non-Indian land category, i.e., State or private.

o Unit agreement and / or participating area name and number, if applicable.

o Communitization agreement number, if applicable.

O 0 0O

(o)

Any venting or flaring of gas shall be done in accordance with Notice to Lessees (NTL) 4A and
needs prior approval from Field Office Petroleum Engineers.

All undesirable events (fires, accidents, blowouts, spills, discharges) as specified in NTL 3A will
be reported to the BLM, Vernal Field Office. Major events as defined in NTL3A, shall be
reported verbally within 24 hours, followed by a written report within 15 days. "Other than Major
Events" will be reported in writing within 15 days. "Minor Events" will be reported on the
Monthly Report of Operations and Production.

Pursuant to Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 7, this is authorization for pit disposal of water
produced from this well for a period of 90 days from the date of initial production. A permanent
disposal method must be approved by this office and in operation prior to the end of this 90-day
period. In order to meet this deadline, an application for the proposed permanent disposal
method shall be submitted along with any necessary water analyses, as soon as possible, but
no later than 45 days after the date of first production. Any method of disposal which has not
been approved prior to the end of the authorized 90-day period will be considered as an Incident
of Noncompliance and will be grounds for issuing a shut-in order until an acceptable manner for
disposing of said water is provided and approved by this office.

Unless the plugging is to take place immediately upon receipt of oral approval, the Field Office
Petroleum Engineers must be notified at least 24 hours in advance of the plugging of the well, in
order that a representative may witness plugging operations. If a well is suspended or
abandoned, all pits must be fenced immediately until they are backfilled. The "Subsequent
Report of Abandonment" (Form BLM 3160-5) must be submitted within 30 days after the actual
plugging of the well bore, showing location of plugs, amount of cement in each, and amount of
casing left in hole, and the current status of the surface restoration.
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Form 3160- 5 UN]TE&STA‘FES" S A FORM APPROVED

(Aprit 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004- 0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007
5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-76032
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. i Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.
1. Type of Weil NA
DOil Well Gas Well DOlher 8. Well Name and No.
2. Name of Operator Wilkin Rldge Federal 14-4-11-17
Gasco Production Company 9. APl Well No.
3a. Address 3b.  Phone No. finclude arca code) 43-013-33099
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (lootage, Sec.. T.. R.. M., or Survey Description) Wildcat
. 11. County or Parish, State
856" FSL & 752' FWL SW SW of Section 4-T11S-R17E
Duchesne County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Nolice of Intent DAcidize DDeepen DProduclion ( Start/ Resume) DWalet Shut-off
DAllering Casing DFraclure Treat I:] Reclamation DWeII Integrity
DSubsequenl Report DCasing Repair DNew Construction DRecomplele Olher Keep data

DC hange Plans DPlug and abandon DTemporan'ly Abandon confidential

DFinal Abandonment Notice DC onverl to Injection DPlug back DWaler Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated stanting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following com pletion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion o recompletion ina new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed  Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the openator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

Gasco Production Company will be moving a rig onto this location to start drilling within
the next few weeks we respectfully request that you keep all records confidential for as long
of a period as possible.

RECEIVED
FEB 02 2007
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING

14. 1 hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Printed Typed)

Title A . .
Beverly Walker Engineering Technician

Date
January 31, 2007

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or]
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease}Office
which  would entitle  the applicant _ to  conduct _ operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitiousor fr or Tepr ions as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
(Instructions on page 2)
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Energy DAILY DRILLING REPORT Y 3-043-33079
AFE # 40159 GPS
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 IPermit Depth:12,580 |Prog. Depth: lDate: 2/8/2007 I Days Since Spud: RM 1
Current Operations: RIG UP
Depth: |Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: #VALUE! IFormation:
DMC: $0 ITMC: $18,170 TDC: $19,500 |CWC: $19,500
Contractor: _ Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-IDRLG FLUIDS |TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
mw: 1 £-1000 3.5 gpm |Bit#: Conductor: $ - Jioc,Cost: $ -
VIS: SPM: ISize: Surf. Csg: $ - IRig Move: $ -
|PVIYP: |#2E-1000 3.5 gpm Type: |Int. Csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: SPM: IMFG: IProd Csg: $ - IRental Tools: $ -
WL.: GPM : SIN: lFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: JPress: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: 3 -
Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - [Fuel $ -
Sand: AV DP: Joepth In: JPackers: $ - lMud Logger: $ -
PH : JetVel: IFTG: Tanks: $ - ILoggIng: $ -
[Pfle: JECD: IHrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: SPR #1 : IFPH: JHeater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: IPumping ur: $ - |mud motors: $ -
iDapp ppb: ]Btm.Up: JR-RPM: IPrlme Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |m-rPM: IMIsc: $ - |consuitant: $ 1,000
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: lDain Total: $ - {Drilling Mud: $ -
12:00 | 18:00 | 6:00 JMOVE IN RIG, SET SUBS, MUD PITS, PUT DERRICK ON FLOOR IMisc.ILabor: $ -
0 0 0:00 Csg. Crew: $ -
0 0 0:00 Daily Total: $ 19,500
0 0 0:00 Cum. Wtr: $ -
0 0 0:00 Cum. Fuel $ -
Cum. Bits: $ -
BHA
0.00
0.00
0.00
RECEIVED -
FEB 08 2007 0.00
L 0.00
UV UFUIL GAS & MINING
TOTAL BHA = 0.00
Survey
BOILER: Survey
P/U K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/0 K# FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. K# LAST CSG. RAN: SET@ PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 1856 On Hand: 5684 Co._NEn Floyd Mitchell — TRIP GAS
OCS DC LOC B/S G oDC RP

BIT # 1 com:morPCS
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HP LASERJET 3200

' STATE OF UTAH

FORM 6

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM
Operator. G35 Production Co Operator Account Number: N 2575
Address: 8 Inveress Drive East, Ste 100
city Englewood .
state CO zip 80112 Phone Number: (303) 483-0044
weR 1
AP1 Number Well Name QQ | Sec Rn County
4301333099 Wilkin Ridge Federal 14-4-11-17 swsw| 4 1 17 Duchesne
Action Code Current Entity Now Entity Spud Date ‘Entity Assignment
Number Numiber Effective Date
A 99999 /5920 wnor | 3//13/07
Comments: ; _
swawel  BLKAK =MV ED — CONFIDENTIAL
Well 2
APl Number Well Name QQ | Sec | Twp County
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number ~ Number A Effective Date
Comments:
Well 3
AP1 Number Well Name QQ | Sec | Twp County
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date
Comments:
ACTION CODES: Bov ﬂ alker

A - Establishnewe

ntity for new well {single well only)

- Add new well to existing entity (group or unit weit)

- Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity

B
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity
D
E

- Other (Explain in ‘comments’ section)

(572000}

@ "‘72"’ Jobll

Englneering Tech 2/9/2007
™ RECEIVED
FEB 09 2007

DIV. OF OlL, GAS & MINING
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Energy DAILY DRILLING REPORT
AFE # 40159 Y 3—p)3- 3304 OPS
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 IPermit Depth:12,580" IProg. Depth: IDate: 2/9/2007 Days Since Spud: RM 2
Current Operations: RIG UP
Depth: IProg: D Hrs: AV ROP: #VALUE! lFormation: UINTA
DMC: $0 ITMC: $18,170 TDC: $143,442 |CWC: $162,942
Contractor:  Frontier RiLG Mud Co: M-1 DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: #1 E-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: Conductor: $ - Jroc,cost: $ 111,752
VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - lRIg Move: $ -
|pvive: J#2€E-1000 3.5 gpm Type: Jint. csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 16,500
Gel: SPM: IMFG: IProd Csg: $ - lRental Tools: $ -
WL: GPM : SIN: IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 1,167
Cake: JPress: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Isolids: AV DC: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - JFuet: $ 11,833
Sand: AV DP: |Depth In: {Packers: $ - IMud Logger: $ -
[PH : JetVel: IFTG: Tanks: $ - lLogging: $ -
I;fle: {ECD: IHrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: SPR#1 : IFPH: iHeater: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: IPumpIng v:  $ - [muamotors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: |Btm.Up: [R-RPM: IPrIme Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |m-RPM: IMIsc: $ - |Consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ -
06:00 | 06:00 | 24:00 JRIG UP, RAISE DERRICK & FLOOR RIG UP FLOOR & FRONT ENllMIsc.ILabor: $ 1,190
TRUCKS & CRANE RELEASED 2/7/2006 @ 19:00 Csg. Crew: $ -
Daily Total: $ 143,442
Cum. Wtr: $ -
Cum. Fuel $ 11,833
Cum. Bits: $ -
BHA
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
RECEIVED 0
0.00
FEB 0972007 0.00
DIV-OF OH-GAS S MHNING
i ' N TOTAL BHA = 0.00
Survey
BOILER: Survey
P/U K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/O K# FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. K# LAST CSG. RAN: SET @ PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: - Co. _Man Floyd Mitchell _ TFﬁAS
OCS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP

IT#1 CONmTlor{JCS
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GASCO GASCO ENERGY
Energy DAILY DRILLING REPORT 73_.013_. 33097
AFE # 40159 GPS
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 IPermit Depth:12,580° |Prog. Depth: IDate: 2/10/2007 I Days Since Spud: S1
Current Operations: DRLG
Depth: 474' lProg: 264' |D Hrs: 51/2 IAV ROP: 48.0 |Formation: UINTA
DMC: $0 |TMC: TDC: $118,205 [CWC: $281,147
Contractor: _ Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-l DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Imw: F  k1E10003.5gpm  [Bit#: 1 Conductor: $ 20,461 JLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: R SPM: 85 Size: 12 1/4" Surf. Csg: $ - IRig Move: $ 58,575
PVIYP: E  [#2E-10003.5 gpm Type: XS 30S Jint. csg: $ - lDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: S SPM: 86 |wrG: SEC IProd Csg: $ - IRentaI Tools: $ 3,895
WL H Jopm: 615 |sm: 10908432 [Fioat Equp: $ 3,977 Jrrucking: $ 1,920
Cake: JPress: 845 JJets: 3X22 Well Head: $ 886 |water: $ -
Solids: W Javoc: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - JFuel: $ -
Sand: A AV DP: Jpepth in: 210’ Packers: $ - IMud Logger: $ -
PH : T JetVel: IFTG: 264 Tanks: $ - ILogging: $ -
Pf/Mf: E |eco: IHrs: 51/2 Separator: $ - Cement: $ 8,569
Chlor: R [sPRi#1: FPH: 48.0 JHeater: $ - |sits:
Ca : SPR#2: WOB: 20/45 IPumping L/T: $ - IMud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: |Btm.Up: JR-RPM: 110 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: N/A IMIsc: $ - [consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: 25.5 IDain Total: $ 24,524 iDriHing Mud: $ -
06:00 | 15:00 | 9:00 JCONT. TORIG UP IMisc./Labor: $ 1,222
15:00 { 21:30 | 6:30 INIPPLE UP FLOW NIPPLE Csg. Crew: $ -
21:30 0:30 3:00 |M/U 12 1/4” BIT, P/U BHA, TRIP IN HOLE TAG CEMENT @ 200’ |Daily Total: $ 118,205
0:30 06:00 | 5:30 |IDRLG 12 1/4" HOLE F/210' T/474' ( 264' @ 488 FPH ) Cum. Wtr: $ -
Cum. Fuel $ 11,833
Cum. Bits: $ -
BHA
BIT 12 1/4" 1.00
1-BS |8 1/2" 1.00
1-8S [81/2" 13.06
2-DCS |81/2" 56.95
1-IBS |12 1/4" 7.33
RECEIVED 1-DC |8 1/2" 28.15
1-IBS 12 1/4" 7.54
FEB_‘ﬁﬂW XO 18-DCS | 6 1/2'
DIV-OF OIL, GAS & MINING TOTAL BHA = 115.03
Survey
BOILER: 24 HRS Survey
P/U K# LITH: BKG GAS
[e) K# FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. K# LAST CSG. RAN: SET@ PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: _ 5916 Co. Man Floyd Mitchell TLH’EAS
BIT # 1 CONDITION ICS [o]eF] DC LOC B/S G oDC RP
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Energy DAILY DRILLING REPORT 73-013_33077 -

AFE # 40159
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 |Permit Depth:12,580" |Prog. Depth: |Date: 2/11/2007 I Days Since Spud: S2
Current Operations: DRLG
Depth: 1676' |Prog: 1202' |D Hrs: 211/2 |AV ROP: 55.9 IFormation: UINTA
DMC: $4,620 |TMC: $4,620 TDC: $25,384 |CWC: $306,531
Contractor: __ Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-IDRLG FLUIDS |TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
mw: F  l#1E-100035gpm  [Bit#: 1 Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: R SPM: 85 Size: 12 1/4" Surf. Csg: $ - IRIg Move: $ -
|PVIYP: E  J#2E-1000 3.5 gpm Type: XS 30S Jint. Csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: S |sPm: 86 |mra: SEC IProd Csg: $ - |Rentai Toots: $ 1,264
WL: H GPM : 615 SIN: 10908432 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: JPress: 1071  Lets: 3X22 Well Head: $ - Water: 3 -
Solids: W Javbc: 162 |Dout: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuer $ -
Sand: A AV DP: 103 |Depth In: 210' [Packers: $ - IMud Logger: $ -
|PH : T JetVel: 177 IFTG: 1466 Tanks: $ - ILogging: 3 -
IPfIMf: E JECD: IHrs: 27 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: R |sPr#1: frpu: 54.2 JHeater: $ - [sits: $
Ca : SPR #2: WOB: 50/55 IPumpIng uvr: $ - wud motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: I8tm.up: 5 MIN |r-rPMm: 100/125 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |w-rPWM: N/A IMssc: $ - [consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs:| 27.0 IDain Total: $ - |oriling Mud: $ 4,620
06:00 | 16:00 | 10:00 |DRLG 12 1/4" HOLE F/474' T/1042' ( 568' @ 56.8 FPH ) IMIsc.lLabor: $ -
16:00 | 16:30 | 0:30 |SERVICE RIG Csg. Crew: $ -
16:30 | 17:00 | 0:30 ]SURVEY @ 992' 1 DEGREE Daily Total: $ 25,384
17:00 | 23:00 | 6:00 [DRLG 12 1/4" HOLE F/1042' T/1360' (318' @ 53 FPH ) Cum. Wtr: $ -
23:00 | 24:00 | 1:00 |JREPAIR FLOW NIPPLE Cum. Fuel $ 11,833
24:00 | 05:00 | 5:00 |DRLG 12 1/4" HOLE F/1360' T/1644' ( 284' @ 56.8 FPH ) Cum. Bits: $ -
05:00 | 05:30 | 0:30 |SURVEY @ 1598' 1 1/2 DEGREES BHA
05:30 | 06:00 | 0:30 |IDRLG F/1644' T/1676' (32' @ 64 FPH) BIT |12 1/4" 1.00
1-BS |8 1/2" 2.85
1-SS |8 1/2" 13.06
2-DCS [81/2" 56.95
1-1BS |12 1/4" 7.33
REC‘EIr‘vIED 1-DC  [8 1/2" 28.15
1-1BS |12 1/4" 7.20
FEB TV Z 2007 X0 18-DCS | 6 1/2 561.20
ALY A TOTAL BHA = 677.74
DTV, UT UL e Survey 10 992’
BOILER: 24 HRS Survey 11/2° 1598'
P/U 120  K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/0 100 K# FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 105 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 13 3/8" SET @210° PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 1624 On Hand: 4292 Co. Man Floyd Mitchell _ TRIP_GAS
ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

BIT # 1 CONDlTIOb{
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Energy DAILY DRILLING REPORT P
AFE # 40159 7 J3079  eps
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 |Permit Depth:12,580' IProg. Depth: |Date: 2/12/2007 | Days Since Spud: S3
Current Operations: DRLG
Depth: 2566’ |Prog: 890' [D Hrs: 19 |AV ROP: 46.8 |Formation: UINTA
DMC: $9,739 |TMC: $14,360 TDC: $83,345 |CWC: $389,876
Contractor: __ Frontier Rig 6_ Mud Co:  M-1DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
IMW: F I#1 E-1000 3.5 gpm |Bit #: 1 2 Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: R SPM: 87 Size: 12 1/4" 12 1/4" |Ssurf. Csg: $ - IRIg Move: $ -
Ipvive: E  |#2E-1000 3.5 gpm Type: XS 308 GF 30B }int. Csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: S |sem: 89 |mra: SEC STC IProd Csg: $ - |Rentai Tooss: $ 1,474
WL H GPM : 615 |sm: 10908432 | PF 4289 IFloat Equp: $ - [Trucking: $ -
Cake: JPress: 1071 Jets: 3X22 3 X 22 ]waeliHead: $ - Jwater: $ -
Solids: W Javbc: 162 Jtoout: 1771 TBG/Rods: $ - [Fuel: $ 11,499
Sand: A AV DP: 103 JDepth In: 210’ 1771'  [Packers: $ - IMud Logger: $ -
|pH : T JetVel: 177 IFTG: 1561 795" |ranks: $ - Logging: $ -
PfIMf: E JECD: IHrs: 29 17 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: R  [sPR#1: lepu: 53.8 46.8  JHeater: $ - [Bits: $ 36,000
Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: 50/55 45/57 IPumpIng LT $ - IMud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: 5 |Btm.Up: 15 MIN JR-RPM: 100/125 100/125 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: N/A N/A IMIsc: $ - fconsultant: $ 1,000
START | END TIME Total Rot. Hrs:|  27.0 IDaIIy Total: $ - [orilling Mud: $ 9,739
06:00 | 08:00 | 2:00 |DRLG 12 1/4" HOLE F/1676' T/1771' (95' @ 47.5 FPH ) IMisc./Labor: $ 5,133
08:00 | 08:30 | 0:30 |BUILD & PUMP SLUG Csg. Crew: $ -
08:30 | 10:30 | 2:00 |TRIP OUT OF HOLE, LAY DOWN BIT #1 Daily Total: $ 83,345
10:30 | 12:00 | 1:30 |M/UBIT # 2 TRIP IN HOLE Cum. Wtr: $ -
12:00 | 12:30 | 0:30 |JWASH & REAM 50' TO BOTTEM NO FILL Cum. Fuel $ 23,332
12:30 | 16:30 | 4:00 |DRLG 12 1/4" HOLE F/1771' T/2025' ( 254' @ 63.5 FPH ) Cum. Bits: $ 36,000
16:30 | 17:00 | 0:30 |SERVICRIG BHA
17:00 | 17:30 | 0:30 |SURVEY @ 1975' 3/4 DEGREE BIT |12 1/4" 1.00
17:30 | 06:00 | 12:30 |DRLG 12 1/4" HOLE F/2025' T/2566' ( 541' @ 43.3 FPH ) 1-BS 181/2" 2.85
1-8S |8 1/2" 13.06
2-DCS [81/2" 56.95
1-IBS |12 1/4" 7.33
P 1-DC (8 1/2" 28.15
RECFE] VED 1-BS |12 1/4" 7.20
FER i v X0 18-DCS | 6 1/2' 561.20
200 TOTAL BHA = 677.74
UIV.OF OIL, GAS & MINING Survey | 3/4° 1975'
BOILER: 24 HRS Survey 11/2° 1598’
P/U 125 K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/0 110  K# FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 116 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 13 3/8" SET @210’ PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 1984 On Hand: 7308 Co.Man Floyd Mitchell _ TRII?ﬂ-\S
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IBIT # 2 CONDITION

AFE # 40159 GPS
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 |Permit Depth:12,580" IProg. Depth: IDate: 2/13/2007 | Days Since Spud: S4
Current Operations: DRLG
Depth: 3355’ |Prog: 789 |D Hrs: 23 IAV ROP: 34.3 |Formation: GREEN RIVER
DMC: $1,068 |TMC: $15,429 TDC: $24,197 |CWC: $414,073
Contractor: _ Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
IMw: 8.4 I#1 E-1000 3.5 gpm IBit #: 2 Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 26 SPM: 87 Size: 12 1/4" Surf. Csg: $ - IRIg Move: $ -
|pvive: }#2€E-1000 3.5 gpm Type: GF 30B Jint. csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: SPM: 89 IMFG: STC IProd Csg: $ - IRentaI Tools: $ 3,629
WL: GPM : 615 |sIN: PF 4289 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: JPress: 1071 Joets: 3X22 Well Head: $ - Jwater: $ -
Solids: AV DC: 162 Jmoout: TBG/Rods: $ - [Fuet: 3 -
Sand: AV DP: 103  pepth In: 1771 JPackers: $ - IMud Logger: $ -
Ie - 9.3 etvel: 177 IFTG: 1584’ Tanks: $ - ILogging: $ -
IPfIMf: .2/10 Jeco: IHrs: 40 Separator: $ - Jcement: $ -
Chlor: 9000 |spr#1: [epu: 39.6 |Heater: 3 - [sits: $ -
Ca : SPR#2: WOB: 45/57 IPumping ur: $ - IMud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: 5 |Btm.Up: 25 MIN JR-RPM: 100/125 IPrIme Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: N/A IMisc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs:| 67.0 IDaIIy Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 1,068
06:00 | 07:00 | 1:00 | DRLG 12 1/4" HOLE F/2566' T/2597' (31' @ 31 FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ -
07:00 | 07:30 | 0:30 JSERVICRIG Csg. Crew: $ -
07:30 | 08:00 | 0:30 |SURVEY @ 2551' 1 DEGREE Daily Total: $ 24,197
08:00 | 06:00 | 22:00 |DRLG 12 1/4" HOLE F/2597' T/3355' (758' @ 34.5 FPH ) Cum, Wtr: $ -
Cum. Fuel $ 23,332
Cum. Bits: $ 36,000
BHA
BIT |12 1/4" 1.00
1-BS |8 1/2" 2.85
_________ 1-SS |8 1/2" 13.06
RECEIVED 2-DCS_[81/2" 56.95
EER 1 3 2007 1-1BS |12 1741 7.33
- 1-DC__|8 1/2" 28.15
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING 1-IBS |12 1/4" 7.20
X0 18-DCS | 6 1/2' 561.20
TOTAL BHA = 677.74
Survey 3/4° 1975’
24:00 BOILER: 24 HRS Survey 1° 2551'
P/U 140 K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/0 120 K# FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 130 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 13 3/8" SET @210’ PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 1508 On Hand: _ 5800 Co. yan Floyd Mitchell _ TRII'-‘_§AS
ICS 0CS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP
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AFE # 40159 GPS
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 |Permit Depth:12,580' IProg. Depth: lDate: 2/14/2007 l Days Since Spud: S5
Current Operations: WAIT ON CEMENT
Depth: 3425’ IPM: 70' D Hrs: 3 IAV ROP: 23.3 IFormation: GREEN RIVER
DMC: $8,677 ITMC: $24,106 TDC: $144,669 |CWC: $558,742
Contractor: Frontierﬂgl 6 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 8.5 |#1 E-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 2 Conductor: $ - iLoc,Cost: $ -
vis: 27  |IsPm: 87  [size: 12 1/4" Surf. Csg: $ 67,680 IRig Move: $ -
|PVIYP: }#2€-1000 3.5 gpm Type: GF 30B Jint. Csg: $ - lDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: SPM: 89 |mFG: STC IProd Csg: $ - lRental Tools: $ 3,629
wL: GPM : 615 |sm: PF 4289 IFIoat Equp: $ - [Trucking: $ -
Cake: JPress: 1071 Jyets: 3X22 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 14,560
Solids: AV DC: 162 |10 Out: 3425' TBG/Rods: $ - [Fuel $ -
Sand: AV DP: 103  |pepth In: 1771 Jpackers: $ - IMud Logger: $ -
len : 9.1 Jetvel: 177 IFTG: 1654 Tanks: $ - ILogging: $ -
IPfIMf: 2/10 [ecob: IHrs: 43 Separator: $ - Cement: $ 20,108
Chior: 9000 |sPri#1: FPH: 38.5 JHeator: $ - [sits: $ -
Ca : 100 |sPR#2: WOB: 45/57 IPumpIng ur:  $ - [Mud Motors: $ -
|pappppb: | 6.1 |Btmup: 31 MIN |R-RPM: 100/125 IPrIme Mover:  $ - [corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: N/A IMIsc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs:}]  70.0 IDain Total: $ 67,680 |prilling Mud: $ 8,677
06:00 | 09:00 | 3:00 |DRLG 12 1/4" HOLE F/3355' T/3425' (70' @ 23.3 FPH) Imisc. s Labor: $ -
09:00 | 10:00 | 1:00 |PUMP SWEEP CIRC & COND HOLE F/CSG Csg. Crew: $ 10,515
10:00 | 12:00 | 2:00 JPUMP SLUG, DROP SURVEY, TRIP OUT OF HOLE Daily Total: $ 76,989
12:00 | 13:00 1:00 JLAY DOWN 8 1/2" BHA Cum. Wtr: $ 14,560
13:00 | 18:00 | 5:00 |JR/U & RUN 78 JNTS 8 5/8" 32# J55 CSG + 2 JNTS 9 5/8" J55 CSG ]cum. Fuel $ 23,332
ON TOP SET @ 3406.40 KB Cum. Bits: $ 36,000
18:00 | 22:00 | 4:00 |CRIC & COND HOLE FOR CEMENT, WAIT FOR SCHU,CEMENT BHA
CREW TO GET RIGGED UP BIT |12 1/4" 1.00
22:00 | 02:00 | 4:00 |PRESS TEST SURFCE LINES(OK ) CEMENT SURF. CSG WITH 1-BS |8 1/2" 2.85
REGENEBO BBLS FRESH H20, FOLLOWED BY 485 SKS CLASS "G" 1-8S [81/2" 13.06
CEMENT MIXED @ 11.0 PPG W/3.91 CUFT/SK YEILD FOLLOWEDQ 2-DCS |81/2" 56.95
FEB 1 4 2004720 SKS CLASS "G" CEMENT MIXED @ 15. 8 PPG WITH 1-BS |12 1/41 7.33
| ..]1,16 YEILD DROP PLUG DISPLACE CEMENT W/30 BBLS FRESH 1-DC  [8 1/2" 28.15
DIy OF Ot A M £ OLLOWED BY 175 BBLS DAP H20 BUMP PLUG TO 1600 | _1-1BS |12 1/4° 7.20
PSI, BLEED OF FLOATS HELD,GOOD CEMENT TO SURFACE X0 18-DCS | 6 1/2' 561.20
02:00 | 04:00 | 2:00 |CEMENT DROPPED ,RUN 180' 1" PIPE 13 3/8" X 8 5/8" ANNULUS |TOTAL BHA = 677.74
TOP OUT WELL W/72 SKS CLASS "G" CEMENT,CEMENT@SURF}Survey 1° 3379'
04:.00 | 06:00 2:00 |WAIT ON CEMENT,NOTE BLM PRESENT FOR CSG & CEMENT |Survey 1° 2551
P/U 140 K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/O 120 K# FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 130 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 13 3/8" SET @210’ PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 1508 On Hand: _ 5800 Co. Man _ Floyd Mitchell TRLGAS
BIT # 2 counmo*‘ﬁs %S o2 e B s oxc e
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AFE # 40159 GPS
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 |Permit Depth:12,580° |Prog. Depth: lDate: 2/15/2007 | Days Since Spud: S6
Current Operations: DRLG
Depth: 3464’ |Prog: 39’ D Hrs: 1/2 AV ROP: 78" IFormation: GREEN RIVER
DMC: $0 ITMC: $24,106 TDC: $28,775 |CWC: $587,517
Contractor:  Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-1 DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
|raw: 84 |#1E100035 gpm  |Bit#: 3 Conductor: $ - Jroc,cCost: $ -
VIS: 26 |spm: 116 Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - IRig Move: $ -
IPvivp: J#2E-1000 3.5 gpm Type: FDS + Jint. csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: SPM: JvFa: STC IProd Csg: $ - [Rrentai Toots: $ 4,618
wL: GPM : 406  [si: PF 0073 IFIoat Equp: $ - [Itrucking: $ 315
Cake: Press: 1028 |Juets: 3x16 Well Head: $ 2,569 Jwater: $ -
Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - JFuet: $ -
Sand: AV DP: [Depth in: 3425 [Packers: $ - IMud Logger: $ -
IPH : 9.2 JetVel: IFTG: 39' Tanks: $ - lL.ogging: $ -
PfIMf: .2/10 Jecp: IHrs: 1/2 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 9000 [sPR#1: [epu: 78' |Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
Ca : 100 SPR#2: WOB: 25/35 IPumping LT: $ - IMud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 6.1 [Btmup: 31 MIN |Rr-rRPM: 70 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 52 IMIsc: $ - Jconsultant: $ 1,000
START | END TIME Total Rot. Hrs:|  70.5 IDain Total: $ 2,569 |orilling Mud: $ -
06:00 | 09:00 3:00 JCONT. TO WAIT ON CEMENT IMIsc.ILabor: $ 1,773
09:00 | 14:00 | 5:00 INIPPLE DOWN SURF. FLOW NIPPLE, WELD ON WELLHEAD Csg. Crew: $ -
14:00 | 20:00 | 6:00 INIPPLE UP BOPE Daily Total: $ 28,775
20:00 | 00:30 | 4:30 JPRESS. TEST UPPER KELLY & LOWER KELLY, PIPE & BLIND __ Jcum. wtr: $ 14,560
RAMS, ANNULAR & CHOKE MANIFOLD AND ALL FLOOR SAFTEYCum. Fuel $ 23,332
VLAVES TO 250 PSI LOW & 5000 PSI HIGH, PRESS. TEST 8 5/8" Jcum. Bits: $ 36,000
32# SURF. CSG TO 1500 PSI ( ALL TESTS OK) BHA
00:30 | 03:30 | 3:00 |INSTALL WEAR BUSHING, M/U BIT # 3 & BHA TRIP IN HOLE BIT |[77/8" 1.00
03:30 | 05:30 | 2:00 |DRILL OUT F. COLLAR & F. SHOE, CLEAN OUT TO 3425' A3 MM |6 1/4" 32.93
05:30 | 06:00 | 0:30 |DRLG F/3425' T/3464' (39' @ 78 FPH ) SS 6 1/4" 10.50
B I TELS |6 1/4" 7.43
TIEVRTVEY IBS 712" 4.97
FEB 15 2007 pc__[6 1/4" 30.84
IBS 71/2" 5.68
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING 17-0cs |6 1/a" 528.42
TOTAL BHA = 621.77
Survey 1° 3379
24:00 BOILER: 24 HRS|Survey 1° 2551
P/U 125 K# LITH: BKG GAS
SIO 115 K# FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 120 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3406' KB PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: __ 312 Co. Man Floyd Mitchell _ TRH’_GéS
ICS 0CS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP
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AFE # 40159
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 |Permit Depth:12,580° lProg. Depth: |Date: 2/16/2007 I Days Since Spud: 1
Current Operations: DRLG
Depth: 4194’ |Pro : 730" [DHrs: 18 1/2 ‘AV ROP: 39.0 lFormation: GREEN RIVER
DMC: $117 9—‘TMC: $21,891 TDC: $43,982 |CWC: $631,499
Contractor:  Frontier Ilgi Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 8.4 |#1 E-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 3 4 Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 26 SPM: 75 Size: 77/8" 7 7/8" [surf.Csg: $ - IRig Move: $ -
IPVIYP: #2E-1000 3.5 gpm Type: FDS + M1 619 |int. Csg: $ - lDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: SPM: 75 IMFG: STC STC IProd Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,964
WL: GPM : 523 SIN: PF 0073 | JW 9650 lFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: Pross: 1305 Juets: 3x16 6 x 16 [well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: AV DC: 397 [toout: 3532 TBG/Rods: $ - Jruer: $ 12,401
Sand: AV DP: 301 iDepth In: 3425' 3532' [Packers: $ - IMud Logger: $ -
|ph : 9.4 etvel: 142 IFTG: 105 667" |ranks: $ - Logging: $ -
[Pfle: 1.2/7.6 JecD: IHrs: 3 16 Separator: $ - Cement: 3 -
Chior: 9000 |sPR#1: [een: 35.6 41.7  [Heater: $ - [sits: $ 10,000
Ca : 100 [sPR#2: WOB: 25/35 10/20 IPumping v $ - lMud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 55 [Ietmup: 12 MIN |rR-RPM: 70 60/70 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 52 68 lMlsc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,000
START | END TIME Total Rot. Hrs:|  70.5 IDain Total: $ - IDrilling Mud: $ 117
06:00 | 08:30 | 2:30 |DRLG F/3464' T/3532' (68' @ 27.2 FPH ) Misc. / Labor: $ -
08:30 | 10:00 | 1:30 |MIX & PUMP PILL, TRIP OUT OF HOLE, LAY DOWN BIT #3 Csg. Crew: $ -
10:00 | 12:00 | 2:00 |M/U BIT #4 TRIP IN HOLE Daily Total: $ 43,982
12:00 | 13:00 | 1:00 JWASH & REAM 65' TO BOTTEM NO FILL Cum. Wtr: $ 14,560
13:00 | 15:30 | 2:30 |DRLG F/3532' T/3622' (90' @ 36 FPH ) Cum. Fuel $ 35733
15:30 | 16:00 | 0:30 |SERVICE RIG Cum. Bits: $ 46,000
16:00 | 03:00 | 11:00 |DRLG F/3622' T/4099' (477' @ 43.3 FPH ) BHA
03:00 | 03:30 | 0:30 |SURVEY @ 4060', 1 DEGREE BIT [77/8" 1.00
03:30 | 06:00 | 2:30 |DRILG F/4099' T/4194' (95' @ 38 FPH ) A3 MM |6 1/4" 32.93
SS 6 1/4" 10.50
TELS |[61/4" 7.43
WASATCH 4829' RECEIVED BS |71/2" 4.97
MEASA VERDE 8904’ B DC 6 1/4" 30.84
CASTLEGATE _11,334' FEBTH 2007 BS |7 112" 5.68
DESERT 11,649 DIV.OF Oi-§ S5t 17-DCS |6 1/4" 528.42
GRASSY 11,739' ’ TOTAL BHA = 621.77
KENILWORTH 12,149’ Survey 1° 3379'
24:00 |TD 12,534’ Survey 1° 4060’
P/U 128 K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/O 125 K# FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 125 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@  3406'KB PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 1984 On Hand: _ 6728 Co. _IVEn Floyd Mitchell o TRIP_IG-AS
BIT # 3 CONDITION—S> 0% e L0¢ B © op< e
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AFE # 40159 GPS
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 IPermit Depth:12,580" |Prog. Depth: |Date: 2/17/2007 | Days Since Spud: 2
Current Operations: DRLG
Depth: 5116' |Prog: 922" |D Hrs: 21 1/2 |AVROP: 42.9 |Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $1,260 |TMC: $23,151 TDC: $22,724 |CWC: $654,223
Contractor:  Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 85 |#1E-100035 gpm Bit #: 4 Conductor: 3 - Jroc,cost: $
ViS: 26 |sPm: 77 Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - IRIg Move: $ -
PV/YP: l#2e-1000 3.5 gpm Type: MI 619 Jint. csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: SPM: 78 MFG: STC IProd Csg: $ - [Rental Tools: $ 1,964
WL: GPM : 541 SIN: JW 9650 IFloat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: Press: 1488 |ets: 6 X 16 Wall Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: AV DC: 411 [oout: TBG/Rods: $ - JFuet $ -
Sand: AV DP: 276  |Depthin: 3532 Packers: $ - IMud Logger: $ -
IPH : 9.2 etvel: 147 IFTG: 1589’ Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 1.2/7.6 |ecD: Hrs: 371/2 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 9000 [sPR#1: FPH: 42.4 Heator: $ - |sits: $ -
Ca : 100 |SPR#2: WOB: 10/20 IPumping LT $ - Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 56 [Btmup: 14 MIN |rR-RPM: 50/60 |Pr|me Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 70 IMIsc: $ - |consutant: $ 1,000
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs:| 110.5 lDain Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,260
06:00 | 10:30 | 4:30 |DRLG F/4194' T/4352' (158' @ 35 FPH ) Misc. / Labor: $ -
10:30 | 11:00 | 0:30 |SERVICE RIG Csg. Crew: $ -
11:00 | 12:00 | 1:00 [REPAIR SWIVEL PACKING Daily Total: $ 22,724
12:00 | 05:00 | 17:00 |DRLG F/4352' T/5084' ( 732' @ 43 FPH ) Cum. Wtr: $ 14,560
05:00 | 05:30 | 0:30 |SURVEY @ 5020' 1 DEGREE Cum. Fuel $ 35733
05:30 | 06:00 | 0:30 |DRLG F/5084' 7/5116' ( 32' @ 64 FPH ) Cum. Bits: $ 46,000
BHA
BIT 77/8" 1.00
13 MM |6 1/4" 32.93
SS 6 1/4" 10.50
TELS (6 1/4" 7.43
WASATCH 4829' ] Y IBS |71/2" 4.97
MEASA VERDE 8904 HECEIVED pc_ |6 14" 30.84
CASTLEGATE 11,334’ FEB 2 U 2007 IBS _|71/2" 5.68
DESERT 11,649’ 17- DCS 6 1/4" 528.42
GRASSY 11,739 UIV. Ur UIL, GAS & MINING TOTAL BHA = 621.77
KENILWORTH 12,149 Survey 1° 5020'
24:00 |TD 12,534 Survey 1° 4060
P/U 145 K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/O 142 K# FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 137 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3406' KB PEAK GAS
FUEL  Used: 1624 OnHand: 5104 Co.Man Floyd Mitchell TRIP GAS
BIT # 4 CONDITION ICS 0OCS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP
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AFE # 40159 GPS
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 |Permit Depth:12,580" IProg. Depth:12,534' |Date: 2/18/2007 | Days Since Spud: 3
Current Operations: DRLG
Depth: 6165 |Prog: 1049" |D Hrs: 23 AV ROP: 45.6 |Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $1,577 |TMC: $24,729 TDC: $23,041 |CWC: $677,264
Contractor:  Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-IDRLG FLUIDS |TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
mw: 8.6 |#1 E-1000 3.5 gpm |Bit #: 4 Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 27  |sPm: 68 Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - IRig Move: $ -
IPVIYP: §#2E-1000 3.5 gpm Type: Mi 619 Jint. Csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: SPM: 69 |MFG: STC IProd Csg: $ - lRentaI Tools: $ 1 ,964
WL: GPM : 478 |siN: JW 9650 IFloat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: JPress: 1170  Ldets: 6 X 16 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: AV DC: 363 Jrpout: TBG/Rods: $ - [Fuel $ -
Sand: AV DP: 244  [pepthIn: 3532' [Packers: $ - IMud Logger: $ -
IpH : 9.0 |Jyetvel: 130 lFTG: 2638’ Tanks: $ - ILogging: $ -
PfiMf: .6/7 |EcD: IHrs: 60 1/2 Separator: $ - Jcement: $ -
Chior: 10000 |SPR#1: IFPH: 43.6 JHeater: $ - |sits: $ -
Ca : 100 |sPR#2: WOB: 10/20 IPumping LT: $ - IMud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 5.6 [Btm.up: 20 MIN |R-RPM: 50/60 IPrIme Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 62 IMlsc: $ - [Consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs:] 133.5 IDaIIy Total: $ - [orilling Mud: $ 1,677
06:00 | 12:00 | 6:00 ]DRLG F/5116' T/5433' ( 317' @ 52.8 FPH ) IMIsc.ILabor: $ -
12:00 | 12:30 | 0:30 |SERVICE RIG Csg. Crew: $ -
12:00 | 03:00 | 14:30 |DRLG F/5433' T/6069' ( 636' @ 43.9 FPH ) Daily Total: $ 23,041
03:00 | 03:30 | 0:30 JSURVEY @ 6000' 1 DEGREE Cum. Wtr: $ 14,560
03:30 | 06:00 | 2:30 JDRLG F/6069' T/6165' ( 96' @ 38.4 FPH) Cum. Fuel $ 35,733
Cum. Bits: $ 46,000
BHA
BIT |77/8" 1.00
A3 MM |6 1/4" 32.93
SS 6 1/4" 10.50
TELS |6 1/4" 7.43
A s BS |71/ 4.97
MEASA VERDE 8904 o ehvEY pc__|61/4" 30.84
CASTLEGATE _ 11,334’ FEB 2 0 2007 IBS _|7.1/2" 5.68
DESERT 11,649' . 17-DCS |6 1/4" 528.42
GRASSY 11,739 UIV-UF UIL, GAS & MINING TOTAL BHA = 621.77
KENILWORTH 12,149’ Survey 1° 5020'
24:00 |TD 12,534 Survey 1° 6000’
P/U 172 K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/O 160 K# FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 165 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3406' KB PEAK GAS
FUEL  Used: 1740 OnHand: 3364 Co.Man__ Floyd Mitchell _ TRIP GAS
ICS 0OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

IT # 4 CONDITION




GASCO

GASCO ENERGY

75 R ey

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
Energy AFE #4015 L/ 3—013~33097 gps
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 |Permit Depth:12,580° IProg. Depth:12,534' |Date: 2/19/2007 | Days Since Spud: 4
Current Operations: DRLG
Depth: 7246’ IPrgﬁ 1081" |D Hrs: 23 AV ROP: 47.0 IFormation: WASATCH
DMC: $3,485 lTMC: $28,215 TDC: $36,103 |CWC: $713,367
Contractor:  Frontier M Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 8.6 I#1 E-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 4 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 27  |sem: 83 Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - IRIg Move: $ -
PVIYP: #2E-1000 3.5 gpm Type: MI 619 Jint. csg: $ - lDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: SPM: 81 |wra: STC lProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,964
WL: GPM : 572 |sIN: JW 9650 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: JPress: 1575 |ets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: AV DC: 435 |roout: TBG/Rods: $ - JFuet: $ 11,154
Sand: AV DP: 292 iDepth In: 3532’ Packers: $ - lMud Logger: $ -
feH : 9.1 |uetvel: 156 IFTG: 3719 Tanks: $ - JLogging: $ -
PH/Mf: .3/6  JEcD: IHrs: 831/2 Separator: $ - Jcement: $ -
Chlor: 1000 |SPR#: [epu: 44.5 Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 100 |ISPR#2: \WOB: 20/27 IPumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 55 |Btmup: 20 MIN |rR-RPM: 50/60 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-rPM: 62 IMisc: $ - |consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs:| 156.5 IDaIIy Total: $ - |Driliing Mud: $ 3,485
06:00 | 13:30 | 7:30 |DRLG F/6165' T/6513' ( 348' @ 46.4FPH ) Misc. / Labor: $ -
13:30 | 14:00 | 0:30 JSERVICE RIG Csg. Crew: $ -
14:00 | 03:00 | 13:00 |DRLG F/6513' T/7150' ( 637' @ 49 FPH) Daily Total: $ 36,103
03:00 | 03:30 | 0:30 |SURVEY @ 7100' 1 DEGREE Cum. Wtr: $ 14,560
03:30 | 06:00 | 2:30 |DRLG F/7150" T/7246' (96' @ 38.4 FPH ) Cum. Fuel $ 46,887
Cum. Bits: $ 46,000
BHA
BIT 77/8" 1.00
13 MM |6 1/4" 32.93
SS 6 1/4" 10.50
TELS [61/4" 7.43
RECEIVED IBS |71/2" 4.97
MEASA VERDE 8904 DC |6 1/4" 30.84
CASTLEGATE 11,334 m IBS |71/2" 5.68
DESERT 11,649' AV AC ALl AAG & siia 17-DCS | 6 1/4" 528.42
GRASSY 11,739’ T T e T TOTAL BHA = 621.77
KENILWORTH 12,149’ Survey 1° 5020'
24:00 |TD 12,534’ BOILER: 24 HRS  |Survey 1° 6000'
P/U 190 K# LITH: BKG GAS 25
SIO 170 K# FLARE: GAS BUSTER: OFF CONN GAS 28
ROT. 180 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ _ 3406 KB PEAK GAS 28
FUEL Used: 1680 On Hand: 5684 Co.Man Floyd Mitchell _ TRIP GAS
IT # 4 CONDITION ICS 0CS DC LOC B/S G oDC RP
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GASCO GASCO ENERGY :
W DAILY DRILLING REPORT 715 W/@j’vy
AFE # 40159 H3-ol5- 33777  GPS
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 |Permit Depth:12,580' IProg. Depth:12,534’ lDate: 2/20/2007 | Days Since Spud: ' 5
Current Operations: DRLG
Depth: 8020’ IPQg: 774’ |D Hrs: 231/2 IAV ROP: 323 IFormation: WASATCH
DMC: $469 ITMC: $28,685 TDC: $21,933 |CWC: $735,300
Contractor: Frontier&gj Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Imw: 87 |#1e-100035 gpm loit #: 4 Conductor: $ - Jroc,cost: $ -
VIS: 29 SPM: 116 Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - IRIg Move: $ -
fpvive: Type: MI 619 ilnt. Csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: SPM: MFG: STC IProd Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,964
WL: GPM : 405 |sIN: JW 9650 lFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: Press: 1250 Lets: 6 X 16 Woell Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: AV DC: 308 Jrpout: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuer $ -
Sand: AV DP: 206 [Depth in: 3532’ Packers: $ - IMud Logger: $ -
lpH : 9.0 |Jetvel: 110 IFTG: 4493’ Tanks: $ - ILogging: $ -
|;Mf: .3/6 [ecp: IHrs: 107 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 4000 |sPr#t: IFPH: 41.2 Heater: $ - [Bits: $ -
Ca : 100 IsPr#2: WOB: 20/27 IPumping ur: $ - |mud motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: 48 [Btmup: 34 MIN |R-RPM: 50/60 lPrime Mover: $ - |corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 53 IMIsc: $ - |Consultant: $ 1,000
START | END TIME Total Rot. Hrs:| 180.0 IDaIIy Total: $ - lDrIlIIng Mud: $ 469
06:00 | 13:00 | 7:00 |DRLG F/7246' T/7532' (286' @ 40.8 FPH ) |Drllling Mud: $ -
13:30 | 13:30 | 0:30 JSERVICE RIG Csg. Crew: $ -
13:30 | 06:00 | 16:30 | DRLG F/7532 T/8020’ ( 488' @ 29.6 FPH ) Daily Total: $ 21,933
( START MUD UP @ 05:00 ) Cum. Wir: $ 14,560
Cum. Fuel $ 46,887
Cum. Bits: $ 46,000
BHA
BIT 77/8" 1.00
43 MM |6 1/4" 32.93
SS 6 1/4" 10.50
DAV ED TELS [61/4" 7.43
et IBS 71/2" 4.97
MEASA VERDE 8904’ FEB 2 0 2007 Dc__ |6 1/4" 30.84
CASTLEGATE 11,334’ BS |71/2" 5.68
DESERT 11,649' DIV.OF OIL, GAS & MINING 147 pes | 6 114" 528.42
GRASSY 11,739’ TOTAL BHA = 621.77
KENILWORTH 12,149' Survey 1° 7100'
24:00 |TD 12,634 BOILER: 24 HRS  |Survey 1° 6000’
PIJ 205 K# LITH: BKG GAS 25
S/0 180 K# FLARE: GAS BUSTER: OFF CONN GAS 28
ROT. 195 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3406'KB PEAK GAS 649
FUEL Used: 1624 OnHand: 4060 Co.Man _Floyd Mitchell TRIIi_GéS N/A
IT # 4 CONDITION ICS 0CS DC LOC B/S G oDC RP
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AFE # 40159 PS
Well:  WRF 14-4-11-17 |Permit Depth:12,580' _ |Prog. Depth:12,534'  |Date: 2/21/2007 | Days Since Spud: 6
Current Operations: DRLG
Depth: 8310’ |ProL 290' |DHrs: 13 AV ROP: 22.3 |Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $18,475 ITMC: $47,160 TDC: $71,341 |CWC: $806,641
Contractor:  Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Imw: 9 I#1 E-1000 3.5 gpm IBit #: 4 5 Conductor: $ JLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 41 SPM: 116 Size: 77/8" 7 7/8" |surt. Csg: $ IRig Move: $ -
PV/YP: 13/9 Type: MI 619 506 Z |]int. Csg: $ IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 4/8/10 |sPm: |mra: STC HTC IProd Csg: $ [Renta Toots: $ 1,964
wL: 108 |orm: 405 Jsm: JW 9650 | 7106218 [Fioat Equp: _ $ Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 IPress: 1298 |Jets: 6 X 16 6 x 16 [well Head: $ Water: $ 8,854
Solids: 5 Javoc: 308 b out: 8262 TBG/Rods: $ Fuel: $ 12,548
IMBT: 9 AV DP: 206 |Ipepthin: 3532 8262' |Packers: $ IMud Logger: $ -
fen - 9.0 |setver: 110 [rre: 4730 48 |ranks: $ Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 212 JEcp: |Hrs: 117 1/2] 2 1/2 [Separator: $ Cement: $ -
Chlor: 3000 JSPR#1: [epu: 40.3 19.2  [Heater: 3 IBits: $ 10,000
Ca : 100 |sPR#2: WOB: 20/27 18/22 IPumping LT: $ IMud Motors: $ -
|oapp ppb: 2 |Btmup: 37 MIN JR-RPM: 50/60 50/70 IPrIme Mover: Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. lM-RPM: 53 53 IMIsc: $ Consultant: $ 1,000
START | END TIME Total Rot. Hrs:|  193.0 IDain Total: $ ~ |orilling Mud: $ 18,475
06:00 | 14:00 | 8:00 |DRLG F/8020' T/8199' ( 179' @ 22.3 FPH ) IDrilling Mud: 3 -
14:00 | 14:30 | 0:30 |SERVICE RIG Csg. Crew: $ -
14:30 | 17:00 | 2:30 |DRLG F/8199' T/8262' ( 63' @ 25 FPH ) Daily Total: $ 71,341
17:00 17:30 | 0:30 [MIX & PUMP SLUG Cum. Wtr: $ 23,414
17:30 | 20:30 | 3:00 JTRIP OUT OF HOLE FORBIT #5 Cum. Fuel $ 59,435
20:30 | 21:00 | 0:30 JLAY DOWN TOP IBS,SHOCK SUB,MM, & BIT #4 Cum. Bits: $ 56,000
21:00 | 21:30 | 0:30 |PULL & INSPECT WEAR BUSHING (OK), RENISTALL BHA
21:30 | 24:00 | 2:30 |P/VU .13 MM M/UBIT # 5 TRIP IN HOLE, TO CSG SHOE, BIT |77/8" 1.00
24:00 | 01:00 1:00 |SLIP & CUT DRILLING LINE A3MM |6 1/4" 32.95
01:00 | 03:00 | 2:30 JCONT TRIP IN HOLE TO 8187 TELS |6 1/4" 7.43
03:00 | 03:30 | 0:30 |JWASH & REAM 75' TO BOTTEM ( NO FILL ) IBS [71/2" 4.97
03:30 | 06:00 | 2:30 |DRLG F/8262' T/8310' (48' @ 19.2 FPH ) . 18- DCS |6 1/4" 559.26
MEASA VERDE 8904’ RECEIVED
CASTLEGATE 11,334 FEB 21 2067
DESERT 11,649 ' '
GRASSY 11,739’ DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING  |TOTAL BHA= 605.61
KENILWORTH 12,149’ Survey 1° 7100’
2400 |TD 12,534' BOILER: 24 HRS |Survey 1° 8024’
P/U 205 K# LITH: BKG GAS 25
S/0 190 K# FLARE: GAS BUSTER: OFF CONN GAS 28
ROT. 200 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3406' KB PEAK GAS 28
FUEL Used: 1868 On Hand: — 7192 Co.Man Floyd Mitchell _ T&EAS N/A
BIT # 4 commo»{ L3 S o< se 22 ° o e
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AFE # 40159 PS
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 |Permit Depth:12,580" lProg. Depth:12,534° lDate: 2/22/2007 I Days Since Spud: 7
Current Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 8988’ IP"QQL 678 D Hrs: 231/2 |AV ROP: 28.85' IFormation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $3,096 ITMC: $50,255 TDC: $33,096 |CWC: $839,737
Contractor: __Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-IDRLG FLUIDS |TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 92 | E-100035 gpm  |sit#: 5 Conductor: $ - Jroc,cost: $ -
VIS: 40 SPM: 110 Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - IRig Move: $ -
1PVIYP: 11/5 Type: 506Z |int. Csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 3/4/7 |sPM: IMFG: HTC IProd Csg: $ - lRentaI Tools: $ 7,000
(WL: 12 GPM : 1 SIN: 7106218 lFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 Press: 1504  Qets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water:
Solids: 2.6 Javbc: 308 [rpout: TBG/Rods: $ - JFuet:
MBT: 6 AV DP: 207 |Depthin: 8262 JPackers: $ - IMud Logger: $ -
H : 9.0 Jyetvel: 110 IFTG: 726 Tanks: $ - ILogging: $ -
EfIMf: .2/4.8 |ecD: 9.44 IHrs: 26 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 4000 |spr#1: 60 @ 350 [epu: 27.9 JHeater: $ - [Bits:
Ca : 120 lIspr#2: WOB: 18/24 lPumpIng vr: $ - Jmud motors: $ 2,500
Dapp ppb: 42 |Btmup: 38 MIN JrR-RPM: 35/55 |Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 45/55 IMisc: $ - Consultant: $ 2,000
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs:| 216.5 lDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 3,096
06:00 | 15:30 | 9.50 |DRILL F/8,310' TO 8,596. ROP = 30.10' Drilling Mud: $ -
15:30 | 16:00 | 0.50 |SERVICE RIG & FUNCTION BOPS Csg. Crew: $ -
16:00 | 06:00 | 14.00 |DRILL F/8,596' TO 8,988'. ROP = 28' Daily Total: $ 33,096
Cum. Wtr: $ 23,41 4
Cum. Fuel $ 59,435
NOTE: SPUDDED THE WRF 43-29-10-17 ON 2/2/07 @ 14:00 HRS Jcum. Bits: $ 56,000
| BHA
BIT |77/8" 1.00
13 MM |6 1/4" 32.95
TELS |6 1/4" 7.43
IBS 71/2" 4.97
18- DCS |6 1/4" 559.26
MEASA VERDE 8904
CASTLEGATE 11,334
DESERT 11,649’
GRASSY 11,739’ TOTAL BHA = 605.61
KENILWORTH 12,149' Survey 1° 7100’
24:00|TD 12,534 BOILER: 24 HRS |Survey 1° 8024'
P/U 230 K# LITH: BKG GAS 40
S/0 200 K# FLARE: GAS BUSTER: OFF CONN GAS 48
ROT. 215 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@  3406'KB PEAK GAS 78
FUEL Used: 1740 On Hand: 5452 Co. Man__ JIM WEIR TRIP_GAS N/A
BIT # 4 connmorF%s Sie oe 1oL B2 | o R
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GASCO GASCOENERGY 75 /7 S0y
Energy DAILY DRILLING REPORT Y3-0,3-33099
AFE # 40159 GPS
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 |Permit Depth:12,580' IProg. Depth:12,534’ |Date: 2/23/2007 I Days Since Spud: 8
Current Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: IProgi D Hrs: 231/2 |AV ROP: IFormation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $6,022 ITMC: $56,277 TDC: $31,202 |CWC: $870,939
Contractor:  Frontier Rigj Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Mw: 9.4 |#1 E-1000 3.5 gpm IBit #: 5 Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 39 |sPm: 110 Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - IRig Move: $ -
|pvive: 9/9 Type: 506Z Jint. Csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 5/12/19 |sPM: IMFG: HTC IProd Csg: $ - IRentaI Tools: $ 2,200
WL: 112 lePm: 1 SIN: 7106218 IFIoat Equp: $ - [Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 Ipross: 1504 Jets: 6 X16 Well Head: $ - Jwater:
Solids: 2.2 JavDpc: 308 D Out: TBG/Rods: $ - {Fuel:
ImBT: 6 AV DP: 207  |pepth in: 8262 JPackers: $ - IMud Logger: $ -
IPH : 9.0 Metvel: 110 IFTG: Tanks: $ - ILogging: $ -
leIMf: .2/5.2 |Ecp: 9.44 IHrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 3000 |IsPr#1: 60 @ 350 IFPH: |Heater: $ - [sits:
iCa : 120 |SPR#2: WOB: 18/28 IPumplng LIT: $ - IMud Motors: $ 2,500
IDapp ppb: 47 [stmup: 38 MIN Jr-RPM: 35/55 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |m-RPM: 45/55 IMisc: $ - |consultant: $ 2,000
START | END TIME Total Rot. Hrs:] 216.5 IDain Total: $ - |prilling Mud: $ 6,022
06:00 | 09:30 | 3.50 |DRILL F/8,988' TO 9,104'. ROP = 33.14' IDriIIIng Mud: $ -
09:30 | 10:00 | 0.50 JSERVICE RIG & FUNCTION HYDRILL Csg. Crew: $ -
10:00 DRILL F/9,104' TO 9, Daily Total: $ 31,202
Cum. Wtr: $ 23,41 4
Cum. Fuel $ 59,435
Cum. Bits: $ 56,000
BHA
BIT 77/8" 1.00
A3 MM |6 1/4" 32.95
13 = TELS [61/4" 7.43
NELEIVEY BS |7 1/2" 4.97
FEB 2 3 2007 18- DCS |6 1/4" 559.26
MEASA VERDE 83804
CASTLEGATE 11,334' DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
DESERT 11,649’
GRASSY 11,739 TOTAL BHA = 605.61
KENILWORTH 12,149 Survey 1° 8024'
24:00 |TD 12,534 BOILER: 12 HRS |Survey 1° 8650’
P/U 230 K# LITH: BKG GAS 40
S/O 200 K# FLARE: GAS BUSTER: OFF CONN GAS 48
ROT. 215 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ _ 3406'KB PEAK GAS 78
FUEL Used: 1740 On Hand: _ 5452 Co. _Man JIM WEIR - TRIPIGAS N/A
BT # 4 com)mor{ s oS b2 Jet B2 > o 5




CONFADENTIAL ¢
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GASCO GASCO ENERGY 17115 R 1E S0y
Energy DAILY DRILLING REPORT Y 3-0lF~ 3309F
AFE # 40159 GPS N 39* 58.52° W 109* 52.09'
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 |Permit Depth:12,580" |Prog. Depth:12,534' IDate: 212412007 | Days Since Spud: 9
Current Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 9777" |Prog: 235 |DHrs: 141/2 |AV ROP: 16.3 IFormation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $4,729 lTMC: $61,006 TDC: $41,879 |CWC: $912,818
Contractor:  Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-l DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
IMw: 9.6 I#1 E-1000 3.5 gpm IBit #: 5 6 Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 42 SPM: 110 Size: 77/8" 7-7/8" |surt. csg: $ - lRig Move: $ -
PV/YP: 12/8 Type: 5062 506ZX |int. Csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 5/14/21 |spm: IMFG: HTC HTC IProd Csg: $ - IRentaI Tools: $ 2,200
W 112 |opm: 1 s 7106218 | 7113994 [Froateque:  $ - lrrucking: $ -
Cake: 1 IPress: 1540 Juets: 6 X 16 6X16 |well Head: $ - Water:
Solids: 2.6 Javoc: 308 JD out: 9550 TBG/Rods: $ - {Fuel: $12,950
ImMBT: 4.8 JAVDP: 207  JDepth In: 8262 9550 |Packers: $ - lMud Logger: $ -
IPH : 9.0 JetVel: 110 IFTG: 1288 235 Tanks: $ - ILogging: $ -
IPfIMf: .2/5.2 JEcD: 9.44 IHrs: 50 14 1/2 |separator: $ - Jcement: $ -
Chlor: 3000 |sPr#1: 60 @ 350 JFPH: 25.8 16.3  [Heater: $ - [sits:
Ca : 120 |sPR#2: WOB: 18/28 20/34 |Pumping ur:  $ - IMud Motors: $ 2,500
IDapp ppb: 47 [Btmup: 39 MIN Jr-RPM: 35/55 35/55 IPrIme Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 45/55 45/55 IMlsc: $ - Consultant: $ 2,000
START | END TIME Total Rot. Hrs:]  255.0 |Daily Total: $ - |orilling Mud: $ 4,729
06:00 | 06:30 | 0.50 |DRILL F/9,542' TO 9,550'. ROP = &' Iorming Mud: $ -
06:30 | 07:00 | 0.50 |PUMP SLUG & DROP SURVEY TOOL Csg. Crew: $ -
07:00 | 11:00 | 4.00 |POOH FOR BIT Daily Total: $ 41,879
11:00 | 15:00 | 4.00 |RIH W/BIT #6 & BREAK CIRC. @ 4,000 Cum. Wtr: $ 23414
15:00 | 15:30 | 0.50 W & R30'TOBOTTOM {NO FILL} Cum. Fuel $ 59,435
15:30 | 18:00 | 2.50 |DRILL F/9,550' TO 9,583' ROP = 13.2' Cum. Bits: $ 56,000
18:00 | 18:30 | 0.50 |RIG SERVICE BHA
18:30 | 06:00 | 11.50 |DRILL F/9,583' TO 9,777'. ROP =17 BIT [77/8" 1.00
A3 MM |6 1/4" 32.95
RECEIVED TELS |6 1/4" 7.43
o IBS |7 1/2" 4.97
FEB 262007 1-DC |6 1/4” 30.84
MEASA VERDE 8904’ DIV OF AL AAS & 8 Ebisie IBS 7.50 5.68
CASTLEGATE 11,334’ o T 17.0cs | 6.25 528.42
DESERT 11,649’
GRASSY 11,739 TOTAL BHA = 611.29
KENILWORTH 12,149’ Survey 1° 8650
24:00 {TD 12,534 BOILER: 24 HRS  |Survey 1° 9158'
P/U 245 K# LITH: BKG GAS 40
S/0 220 K# FLARE: GAS BUSTER: OFF CONN GAS 54
ROT. 230 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3406 KB PEAK GAS 80
FUEL Used: 876 On Hand: — 7076 Co._IVEl JIM WEIR — TRIP_GAS N/A
IT # 5 CONDITION 5> O%S 2L oL N ° o e




CONHDENTIAL

GASCO GASCO ENERGY TS K19 S0
"‘E‘ﬁ‘é‘i:g“y“ DAILY DRILLING REPORT ( Z~0l3~ 33087
AFE # 40159 GPS N 39* 58.52' W 109* 52.09'
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 |Permit Depth:12,580" IProg. Depth:12,534' |Date: 2/25/2007 I Days Since Spud: 10
Current Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 10,175’ IProg: 398' |D Hrs: 211/2 [AV ROP: 18.5 |Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $3,244 ITMC: $64,250 TDC: $27,444 |CWC: $940,262
Contractor:  Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-l DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 9.8  J#1 E-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 5 6 Conductor: $ - iLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 46  |sPm: 105 Size: 77/8" 7-7/8" |surf. Csg: $ - IRig Move: $ -
PV/YP: 11/14 Type: 5067 506ZX [int. Csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 10/26/35 |sPm: |vFa: HTC HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rrentai Tools: $ 2,200
WL: 12.4 JGPM: 1 SIN: 7106218 | 7113994 |Fioat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 Press: 1540 |yets: 6X16 6X16 |wel Head: $ - Water:
Solids: 4.8 JavDpc: 308 | out: 9550 TBG/Rods: $ - hFuel: $
[meT: 1 AV DP: 207  |pepth In: 8262 9550 [Packers: $ - IMud Logger: $ -
IPH : 9.0 Jetvel: 110 IFTG: 1288 625 [Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
IPf/Mf: .2/5 |eco: 9.44 IHrs: 50 36 Separator: $ - Jcement: $ -
Chlor: 3000 |sPr#1: 68 @715 IFPH: 25.8 17.4  [Heator: $ - [sits: $
Ca : 100 |SPR#2: WOB: 18/28 32/36 IPumping LIT: $ - IMud Motors: $ 2,500
Dapp ppb: 46 [Btm.up: 45 MIN [r-RPM: 35/55 40/55 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 45/55 45/50 IMIsc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs:|  255.0 IDaIIy Total: $ - [orilting Mud: $ 3,244
06:00 | 12:00 | 6.00 |DRILL F/9,777' TO 9,872'. ROP = 15.83' lDrIIIIng Mud: $ -
12:00 | 12:30 | 0.50 |RIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: $ -
12:30 | 13:30 | 1.00 |DRILL F/9,872' TO 9,899'. ROP = 27' Daily Total: $ 27,444
13:30 | 15:30 | 2.00 JREPAIR PACKING SWIVEL . {WHILE CIRCULATING} Cum. Wtr: $ 23,414
15:30 | 06:00 | 14.50 |DRILL F/9,899' TO 10,175 ROP =19.03 Cum. Fuel $ 59,435
Cum. Bits: $ 56,000
{NO SLIP STICKING} BHA
BIT |[77/8" 1.00
(o] Py A3 MM |6 1/4" 32.95
MECEIVED TELS |6 1/4" 7.43
FEB 2 6 2007 IBS |7 1/2" 4.97
1-DC |6 1/4" 30.84
MEASA VERDE 8904' UiV, UF OIL, GAS & MINING IBS 7.50 5.68
CASTLEGATE 11,334 17-DCS 6.25 528.42
DESERT 11,649
GRASSY 11,739’ TOTAL BHA = 611.29
KENILWORTH 12,149 Survey 1° 8650’
24:00 |JTD 12,534’ BOILER: 24 HRS  |Survey 1° 9158’
P/U 245 K# LITH: BKG GAS 40
SIO 220 K# FLARE: GAS BUSTER: OFF CONN GAS 418
ROT. 230 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ _ 3406'KB PEAK GAS 2059
FUEL Used: 1740 On Hand: _ 5336 Co. _IYI_an JIM WEIR _ TRIP_GAS N/A
IT#5 conomor{ LS 028 = et 2 S oD o




GASGO

GASCO ENERGY

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

CONRDEN T,

7 /s RI12E S-04

E n e rgy AFE # 40159 gpsﬂ 9‘:5?5§p\l€%9* 52.09
Well: __WRF 14-4-11-17_|Permit Depth:12,580' _|Prog. Depth:12,534' | Date: 2/26/2007 | Days Since Spud: 11
Current Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 10547 |Prog: 372 D Hrs: 21 1/2 |AV ROP: 17.3 |Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $3,935 |TMC: $68,186 TDC: $28,135 |CWC: $968,397
Contractor:  Frontier RLg 6 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
jmw: 9.9 |#1 E-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 5 6 Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
vIS: 52  |IsPm: 105 Size: 77/8" 7-7/8" [|surf. csg: $ - Ing Move: $ -
PVIYP: 14/16 Type: 506Z 506ZX ]int. Csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 13/27/44 IsPm: MFG: HTC HTC IProd Csg: $ - IRentaI Tools: $ 2,200
WL: 10.8 |GPM: 1 SIN: 7106218 | 7113994 IFIoat Equp: $ - Jrrucking: $ -
Cake: 1 Press: 1700 JJets: 6 X 16 6X16 Jwell Head: $ - Water:
Solids: 3 AV DC: 308 |mout: 9550 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet: $
|mwBT: 1 AV DP: 207  Jpepth in: 8262 9550 |Packers: $ - lMud Logger:
IEH : 9.0 Jetvel: 110 IFTG: 1288 997  ITanks: $ - ILogglng: $ -
IPfIMf: .2/4.9 [EcD: 9.44 IHrs: 50 57 1/2 ]separator: $ - Jcement: $ -
Chlor: 3000 ISPR#1: 68 @ 715 JFPH: 25.8 17.3  [Heater: $ - |sits: $
Ca : 140 |[SsPR#2: WOB: 18/28 32/36 IPumpIng L/T: $ - lMud Motors: $ 2,500
Dapp ppb: 44 [IBtmup: 51 MIN JrR-RPM: 35/55 40/55 [Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 45/55 45/50 IMIsc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME 0 Total Rot. Hrs:| 276.5 IDaIIy Total: $ - [orilling Mud: $ 3,935
06:00 | 16:30 | 10.50 |DRILLING F/10,175' TO 10,380'. ROP = 19.52' Drilling Mud: $ -
16:30 | 17:00 | 0.50 |SERVICE RIG Csg. Crow: $ -
17:00 | 02:00 | 9.00 |DRILL F/10,380' TO 10,529'. ROP = 16.55 Daily Total: $ 28,135
02:00 | 04:00 | 2.00 JCIRCULATE & RE-PACK SWIVEL Cum. Wtr: $ 23414
04:00 | 06:00 | 2.00 |DRILL F/10,529' TO 10,547'. ROP=9' Cum. Fuel $ 72385
Cum. Bits: $ 56,000
{NEW GENERATOR WILL NOT BE ON LOCATION UNTIL BHA
WEDNESDAY 2/28/2007} BIT [|77/8" 1.00
NOTE: WE HAVE NOT HAD ANY SLIP STICKING W/BIT. A3 MM |6 1/4" 32.95
TELS |6 1/4" 7.43
- IBS |71/2" 4.97
RECEIVED 1-DC |6 1/4" 30.84
MEASA VERDE 8904 FEB 2 51900'7 iIBS 7.50 5.68
CASTLEGATE 11,334 17-DCS | 6.25 528.42
DESERT 11,649’ IV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING
GRASSY 11,739 TOTAL BHA = 611.29
KENILWORTH 12,149 Survey 2 9550’
24:00 |TD 12,5634 BOILER: 24 HRS [Survey 2 10300
P/U 255 K# LITH: BKG GAS 110
S/O 235 K# FLARE: GAS BUSTER: OFF CONN GAS 235
ROT. 242 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3406' KB PEAK GAS 679
FUEL Used: 1740 On Hand: _ 3596 Co._Man JIM WEIR _ TRIIEAS N/A
BIT #5 commor{ S OX8 o HoC o2 > oD i
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GASCO ENERGY

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

CONFIDENTIAL
T8 RI7E s04
L/ 3-0l3~ 33077

GPS N 39* 58.52' W 109* 52.09'

AFE # 40159
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 lPermit Depth:12,580" IProg. Depth:12,534' |Date: 2/27/12007 l Days Since Spud: 12
Current Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 10758’ |Prog: 211 D Hrs: 141/2 |AV ROP: 14.55' IFormation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $8,285 ITMC: $76,471 TDC: $56,821 |CWC: $1,025,218
Contractor: _ Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
mw: 10 J#1e100035 gpm Bit #: 6 7 Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 48 SPM: 105 Size: 77/8" 7-7/8" Jsurf. Csg: $ - IRig Move: $ -
Ipvive: 13/16 Type: 506ZX 506ZX |int. Csg: $ - lDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 10/26/34 }sPm: IMFG: HTC HTC IProd Csg: $ - IRentaI Tools: $ 2,200
WL: 12 |GPMm: 1 SIN: 7113994 | 7108282 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 1,600
Cake: 1 Press: 1265 Jets: 6 X16 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: 3.6 Javpc: 281 [moout 10569 TBG/Rods: $ - JFuel: $13,236
|mBT: 1 AV DP: 189 |pepth In: 9550 10569 [packers: $ - IMud Logger: $
IPH : 9.0 Metvel: 101 IFTG: 1019 188 |]ranks: $ - Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: .3/5.4 [ecD: 10.38 IHrs: 60 1/2} 11 Separator: $ - |cement: $ -
Chior: 3000 [sPrR#1: 60 @480 |FPH: 16.8 17.1  JHeater: $ - |sits: 3 12,000
Ca : 120 |SPR#2: WOB: 25/37 20/28 lPumping LT $ - IMud Motors: $
IDapp ppb: 4.8 |Btmup: 53 MIN JrR-RPM: 40/55 70/75 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-rPM: 45/50 NA  |wise: $ - |consutant: $ 1,000
START | END TIME 0 Total Rot. Hrs:|  276.5 IDain Total: $ - Jorilling Mud: $ 8,285
06:00 | 09:30 | 3.50 |DRILL F/10,547' TO 10,5670'. ROP = 6.57" IDrlmng Mud: $ -
09:30 | 10:00 | 0.50 |SLUG DRILL PIPE & DROP SURVEY TOOL Csg. Crew: $ -
10:00 | 14:00 | 4.00 JPOOH FOR BIT DUE TO ROP. /D MOTOR & TELE. TOOL Daily Total: $ 56,821
14:00 | 18:30 | 4.50 |M/U BIT, BS, & MOVE IBS STB'S Cum. Wtr: $ 23414
18:30 | 19:00 | 0.50 |REAM & WASH TO BOTTOM NO FILL. {RECALIBRATED HOOK _ |cum. Fuel $ 85,621
LOAD} Cum. Bits: $ 68,000
19:00 | 06:00 | 11.00 |DRILL F/10,570' TO 10,758". ROP = 17.09' BHA
BIT 77/8" 1.00
o BS 6 1/4" 4.00
RECEIVED 1-0Cc__|6 1/4" 30.84
EEB_Z_L2007 IBS 7 1/2" 4.97
) 1-DC |6 1/4" 30.79
MEASA VERDE _8904' DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING IBS 7.50 5.68
CASTLEGATE 11,334 16-DCS 6.25 497.63
DESERT 11,649'
GRASSY 11,739 TOTAL BHA = 631.10
KENILWORTH 12,149’ Survey 2 10300'
24:00 |TD 12,534’ BOILER: 24 HRS |Survey 21/4 10569’
P/U 260 K# LITH: BKG GAS 155
S/0 230 K# FLARE: N GAS BUSTER: OFF CONN GAS 485
ROT. 245 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@  3406'KB PEAK GAS 1972
FUEL Used: 1740 On Hand: ___ 3596 Co.Man__JIM WEIR _ TRIP GAS 2538
BIT#6 COND"IOB{ I%S Ogs BSI': lbc;'f': B)/(S CI;‘ (\DA?_E 22 ONE PLUUGED JET




GASCO
Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

AFE # 40159

CONFIDENTIAL

TUS Ring oy

Y3~0/13~33097
GPS N 39* 58.52° W 109" 52.09'

Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 |Permit Depth:12,580° IProg. Depth:12,534' |Date: 2/28/2007 | Days Since Spud: 13
Current Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 10993’ |Prog: 235 |D Hrs: 23 AV ROP: 10.2 |Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $4,890 ITMC: $81,361 TDC: $62,053 |CWC: $1,087,271
Contractor:  Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-l DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Jmw: 10 |#1 E-1000 3.5gpm _|Bit#: 6 7 Conductor: $ - Jtoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 52 SPM: 111 Size: 77/8" 7-7/8" |surt. Csg: $ - IRig Move: $ -
IpvIYP: 12/18 Type: 506ZX 506ZX |]int. Csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 11/24/34 |spPm: MFG: HTC HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 2,200
WL: 10 GPM : 1 SIN: 7113994 | 7108282 lFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $
Cake: Press: 1366 |uets: 6 X16 6X16 [well Head: $ - Water: $7,463
Solids: AV DC: 281 |jmbout 10569 TBG/Rods: $ - JFuet: $
iMBT: AV DP: 189 Jpepthin: 9550 10569 JPackers: $ - IMud Logger: $
IPH : 9.0  Jetvel: 101 IFTG: 1019 424  |ranks: $ - JLogging: $ -
PfIMf: .3/6.2 JECD: 10.38 IHrs: 60 1/2] 36 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 3000 |sPr#t: 62 @555 fFeu: 16.8 11.8  [Heater: $ - [Isits: $ 28,000
Ca: 120 |sPR#2: WOB: 25/37 28/39 lPumpIng LT: $ - IMud Motors: $
Dapp ppb: 4 IBtmup: 54 MIN [R-RPM: 40/55 65/75 IPrIme Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 45/50 N/A IMIsc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,000
START | END TIME 0.50 Total Rot. Hrs:}  310.5 IDain Total: $ - |oriling Mua: $ 4,890
06:00 | 17:00 | 11.00 |DRILL F/10,758' TO 10,883. ROP = 11.36' IDrIIIlng Mud: $ -
17:00 | 17:30 | 0.50 |SERVICE RIG Csg. Crow: $ -
17:30 | 18:00 | 0.50 |RIG REPAIR. P/U OFF BOTTOM & CIRC. @ 50 SPM. WHILE Daily Total: $ 62,053
CLEAN RADIATOR ON #2 MOTOR. TO HELP FROM OVER Cum. Wtr: $ 30,877
HEATING. {STILL WAITING ON SPARE GENERATOR} Cum. Fuel $ 85621
18:00 | 0600 | 12.00 |DRILL F/10,883 TO 10,993'. ROP =9.16' Cum. Bits: $ 96,000
_ BHA
RECEIVED BIT |778" 1.00
FEB_z_s_m BS 6 1/4" 4.00
) 1-DC__|6 1/4” 30.84
DIV. OF OiL. GiS & MINING IBS [71/2" 4.97
1-DC |6 1/4" 30.79
MEASA VERDE 8904 IBS 7.50 5.68
CASTLEGATE 11,334 16-DCS | 6.25 497.63
DESERT 11,649’
GRASSY 11,739 TOTAL BHA = 631.10
KENILWORTH 12,149 Survey 2 10300
24:00 |TD 12,5634 BOILER: 24 HRS  |Survey 2 1/4 10569’
PV 260 K# LITH: BKG GAS 433
S/0 230 K# FLARE: N GAS BUSTER: OFF CONN GAS 1798
ROT. 245 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3406' KB PEAK GAS 1650
FUEL Used: On Hand: — Co. _Mﬂ'l JIM WEIR — TRIP_GAS N/A
IT#6 COND'T'O* 7 BT ot X T wr PR—| ONE PLUUGED JET




CONFIDENTIAL

GASCO GASCO ENERGY .
—ETI—E_I;—— DAILY DRILLING REPORT 7/ _\50/‘5_/3?2-;:-05?’07
gy L/éPS N 39* 58.52' W?OS* 52.09'
AFE # 40159 .
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 IPermit Depth:12,580’' IProg. Depth:12,534' |Date: 3/1/2007 I Days Since Spud: 14
Current Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 11288’ IPQg: 295 D Hrs: 231/2 |AV ROP: 12.6 |Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $6,875 ITMC: $88,236 TDC: $42, 106 |CWC: $1,129,377
Contractor:  Frontier RLg 6 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
[aw: 10 |#1 E-10003.5gpm  |Bit#: 6 7 Conductor: 3 - JLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 55 |spm: 106 Size: 77/8" 7-7/8" |surf. Csg: 3 - IRIg Move: $ -
|evive: 15/22 Type: 506ZX 506ZX |int. Csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 15/34/46 |spm: |mre: HTC HTC IProd Csg: $ - [Rentar Toots: $ 2,200
WL: 10.8 JGPMm: 1 SIN: 7113994 | 7108282 IFIoat Equp: $ - ]rrucking: $
Cake: 1 Press: 1384 |oets: 6 X 16 6X16 ]well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: 3 AV DC: 281 |rpout: 10569 TBG/Rods: 3 - |Fuel: $13,531
ImBT: 10.8 JAvDP: 189 |pepth in: 9550 10569 |Packers: $ - IMud Logger: $
lew - 900 |setver: 101 _[rre: 1019 | 719 [ranks: $ - |ogaing: $ !
P1/Mf: .2/5.5 |EcD: 10.38 [Hrs: 60 1/2] 59 1/2 |separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 2000 [spr#1: 62 @555 |FPH: 16.8 12.1 _ |Heater: $ - sits: $ -
Ca: 120 |sPR#2: WOB: 25137 26/38 IPumping UT: $ - Mud Motors: $
Dapp ppb: 41 |Btm.up: 55.5 MIN|R-RPM: 40/55 70/80 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: |Tota| D.T. IM-RPM: 45/50 N/A IMIsc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,000
START | END TME | ggo ‘ Total Rot. Hrs:| 334.0 IDaily Total: $ - [oritling Mud: $ 6,875
06:00 | 16:00 | 10.00 |DRILL F/ 10,993 TO 11,107. ROP = 11.4' IDriIIing Mud: $ -
16:00 | 16:30 | 0.50 |SERVICE RIG Csg. Crew: $ -
16:30 | 06:00 | 13.50 |DRILL F/11,107' TO 11,288'. ROP = 13.40' Daily Total: $ 42 106
Cum. Wtr: $ 30,877
Cum. Fuel $ 85,621
FRONITER HAD TO SEND GENERATOR TO SALT LAKE FOR Cum. Bits: $ 96,000
REPAIR. COULD BE TWO WEEKS BEFORE WE GET IT BACK. BHA
BIT 77/8" 1.00
BS 6 1/4" 4.00
1-DC {6 1/4" 30.84
o gy IBS 712" 4.97
RECEIVED 1-DC__ |6 174" 30.79
MEASA VERDE 8904 MAR—UJ—ZGO’ IBS 7.50 5.68
CASTLEGATE 11,334 ' 16-DCS 6.25 497.63
DESERT 11,649’ DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
GRASSY 11,739" TOTALBHA = 631.10
KENILWORTH 12,149 Survey 2 10300'
24:00 |TD 12,534’ BOILER: 24 HRS Survey 21/4 10569’
P/U 260 K# LITH: BKG GAS 912
L1[e) 235 K# FLARE: N GAS BUSTER: OFF CONN GAS 3100
ROT. 249 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3406 KB PEAK GAS 4094
FUEL Used: 1392 On Hand: 7424 Co.Man JIMWEIR TR&AS N/A
BIT #6 CONDITION—22 102 Bt S % 7 W PR ONEPIUGGEDJET
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GASCO GASCO ENERGY TUIS R 7 S0Y
_E_"ﬁ“é_@ DAILY DRILLING REPORT Y F~0/3— ;330.7 g ) '
AFE # 40159 GPS N 39* 58.52' W 109* 52.09
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 |Permit Depth:12,580° IProg. Depth:12,534' lDate: 3/2/2007 | Days Since Spud: 15
Current Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 11320° |Prog: 32 D Hrs: 6 |AV ROP: 5.3 |Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $3,855 ITMC: $92,092 TDC: $25,5655 |CWC: $1,154,932
Contractor:  Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-1 DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 102 |#1 E-1000 35 gpm  |Bit#: 7 7 Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
viS: 55  |sPm: 105  |size: 77/8" 7-7/8" [surt.Csg: $ - Ing Move: $ -
IPvive: 19/20 Type: 506ZX 506ZX+ |]int. Csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 14/28/40 |sPMm: IMFG: HTC HTC IProd Csg: $ - IRentaI Tools: $ 2,200
Wi 104 |opm: 369 |sm: 7108282 | 7114428 [Foateque:  § - |rrucking: $
Cake: 1 Press: 1343  Quets: 6 X 16 6X16 [well Head: $ - Water: $
Sofids: 3 Javpe: 281 [tDOut: 11311 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet:
MBT: 10.8 JAVDP: 189 |pepthin: 10569 11311 JPackers: $ - IMud Logger: $
EI : 9.0 Metvel: 101 IFTG: 742 9 Tanks: $ - ILogging: $ -
IPfIMf: 2/4.8 Jecp: 10.67 lHrs: 631/2] 2 Separator: $ - Jcement: $ -
Chlor: 2000 |sPR#1: 62 @555 . 11.7 4.5  JHeater: $ - |sits: $ -
Ca : 100 |SPR#2: WOB: 30/42 4/31 IPumping LT: $ - Mud Motors: $
|Dapp ppb: 4.4 iBtm.Up: 57 JR-RPM: 70/80 70/80 |Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: N/A N/A IMIsc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME 0.50 Total Rot. Hrs:| 334.0 IDain Total: $ - {Drilling Mud: $ 3,855
06:00 | 10:00 | 4.00 |DRILL F/12,288' TO 11,311'. ROP =5.75 IDrIIIIng Mud: $ -
10:00 | 11:00 | 1.00 |PRESSURE INCREASED F/1366 TO 1700 PSI. P/U & CIRC. Csg. Crew: $ -
WHILE BUILD SLUG Daily Total: $ 25,555
11:00 | 11:30 | 0.50 ]SLUG DRILL PIPE & DROP SURVEY TOOL Cum. Wtr: $ 30,877
11:30 | 16:30 | 5.00 |POOH L/D ONE DAMAGED DC & L/D BS. BIT WAS RINGED OUT jcum. Fuel $ 99,152
16:30 | 17:00 | 0.50 |PULL & REPLACE WEAR BUSHING Cum. Bits: $ 96,000
17:00 | 19:30 | 2.50 |M/U BIT & P/U NBS & RIH TO SHOE BHA
19:30 | 21:30 | 2.00 |CIRC. @ SHOE & SLIP & CUT 112' DRILLING LINE BIT |77/8" 1.00
21:30 | 23:30 | 0:00 JREPLACE SWIVEL PACKING AGAIN NBS [61/4" 4.37
23:30 | 0300 | 12:00 JCONT.RIH TO 11,260 1-DC |6 1/4" 30.84
03:00 | 04:00 | 1.00 JWASH & REAM TO BOTTOM, FAN BOTTOM FOR JUNK IBS 71/2" 4.97
04:00 | 0600 | 12:00 |DRILL F/11,311' TO 11,320' ROP =4.5 1-DC |6 1/4" 30.79
MEASA VERDE 8904 IBS 7.50 5.68
CASTLEGATE 11,334’ RECEIVED 15-DCS | 6.25 466.65
DESERT 11,649’ M,
GRASSY 11,739 ' TOTAL BHA = 544.30
KENILWORTH 12,149’ DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING Survey 21/4 10569’
24:00 |TD 12,534 BOILER: 24 HRS |Survey 11/2 11311
PV 260 K# LITH: BKG GAS 610
S/I0 235 K# FLARE: N GAS BUSTER: OFF CONN GAS N/A
ROT. 248  K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@  3406'KB PEAK GAS 700
FUEL Used: 1508 On Hand: — 5916 Co._Mﬂ JIM WEIR _ TRIP GAS 7586
prsccowomo] 5 | O [ oo T e T es T o T oo [




GASCO
Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

AFE # 40159

CONFIDENTIAL

7S R 19 504

Y3—-0l3- 23099
GPS N 39* 58.52' W 109* 52.09'

Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 IPermit Depth:12,580" lProg. Depth:12,534' |Date: 3/3/2007 | Days Since Spud: 16
Current Operations: WASH & REAM TO BOTTOM
Depth: 11387’ IProg: 67 D Hrs: 10 AV ROP: 6.7 IFormation: CASTLEGATE
DMC: $2,476 ITMC: $94 568 TDC: $44,476 |CWC: $1,199,408
Contractor:  Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Mw: 10.4 I#1 E-1000 3.5 gpm IBit #: 7 7 Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 52 |spm: 105 Size: 77/8" 7-7/8" |surt. csg: $ - IRig Move: $ -
fevive: 14/20 Type: 506ZX+ | XS44DSR {int. Csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 12/27/41 |sPM: |vFa: HTC SEC IProd Csg: $ - |Rentai Tools: $ 2,500
WL: 10 |GPM: 369 |s: 7114428 10858826IFloat Equp: $ - Trucking: $
Cake: 1 IPress: 1343 Qets: 6 X16 3X18 |well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: 10 Javbc: 281 [|TDout: 11387 TBG/Rods: $ - JFuel
MBT: 6.8 |avor: 189 |Depth In: 11311 11387 [Packers: $ - lMud Logger: $
H-l : 9.0 JJetvel: 101 IFTG: 76 0 Tanks: $ - ILoggIng: $ -
IPfIMf: .2/5.3 [EcD: 10.67 |Hrs: 121/2] O Separator: $ - [cement: $ -
Chlor: 2000 [sPrR#1: 62 @555 |rpu: 6.1 0.0  [Heater: $ - |sits: $ 20,000
Ca : 120 |sPr#2: WOB: 25/40 0 IPumpIng ur: $ - IMud Motors: $
IDapp ppb: 49 |Btm.Up: 57  JrR-RPM: 65/75 70/80 IPrIme Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total DT. [M-RPM: N/A N/A IMIsc: $ - |consultant: $ 1,000
START | END TIME 0.50 Total Rot. Hrs:|  334.0 IDain Total: $ - Jprilling Mud: $ 2,476
06:00 | 08:00 | 2.00 |DRILL F/11,320' TO 11,330'. ROP =5 IDrIIIing Mud: $ -
08:00 | 08:30 | 0.50 |SERVICE RIG Csg. Crew: $ -
08:30 | 17:00 | 8.50 |DRILL F/11,330' TO 11,387'. ROP =6.7" Daily Total: $ 44,476
17:00 | 22:30 ] 5.50 |[POOH FOR BIT DUE TO ROP Cum. Wtr: $ 30,877
22:30 | 05:00 | 6.50 |MAKE UP NEW BIT & RIH BREAK CIRC. @ 3,000' & 8,000 Cum. Fuel $ 99,152
05:00 | 06:00 | 1.00 JWASH & REAM TO BOTTOM Cum. Bits: $ 116,000
BHA
BIT 77/8" 1.00
FLARE: 8' 1/2 HR FOR TRIP GAS NBS {6 1/4" 4.37
QECE“!FD 1-DC |6 1/4" 30.84
IBS |71/2" 4.97
MAR T 5 2007 1-DC__|6 14" 30.79
MEASA VERDE 8904 o mam o LAAIAIS IBS 7.50 5.68
CASTLEGATE 11,334' UV, OF UG ORI TOVIING VG 15-DCS 6.25 466.65
DESERT 11,649'
GRASSY 11,739 TOTAL BHA = 544.30
KENILWORTH 12,149’ Survey 21/4 10569’
24:00 [TD 12,534 BOILER: 24 HRS  |Survey 11/2 11311
P/U 260 K# LITH: BKG GAS 764
S/IO0 235 K# FLARE: YEGAS BUSTER: ON CONN GAS 2250
ROT. 248 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3406 KB PEAK GAS 2698
FUEL Used: 1640 On Hand: — 4276 Co.ijn JIM WEIR - TRIF:_SiAS 6468
BIT # 7CONDITION|7|%S SN e Loc 22 S o i




GASCO
Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

CONFIDENTIAL
7/ RI176 S04
Y3-0Il3-23077

AFE # 40159 GPS N 39* 58.52' W 109* 52.09'
Well: _ WRF 14-4-11-17_|Permit Depth:12,580' _|Prog. Depth:12,534' __|Date: 3/4/2007 | Days Since Spud: 17
Current Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 11490’ IProg: 103 |D Hrs: 13 AV ROP: 7.92' IFormation: CASTLEGATE
DMC: $1,460 ITMC: $96,028 TDC: $49,491 |CWC: $1,248,899
Contractor:  Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
[mw: 10.4 |#1 E-1000 3.5gpm  [Bit#: 9 10 Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 50 SPM: 105 Size: 77/8" 7-7/8" |surf. Csg: $ - IRig Move: $ -
|PviYP: 17/16 Type: XS44DR |HC506ZX+]int. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 13/27/42 {sPm: IMFG: SEC HTC IProd Csg: $ - IRentaI Tools: $ 2,500
W 12 Jeem: 369 lsm: 10858826| 7114781 [FioatEqup: 3 - |rrucking: $
Cake: 1 IPress: 1550 |uets: 3X18 6X16 [waell Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: 10.6 JAvDC: 281 |mout: 11430 TBG/Rods: $ - JFuel: $13,531
[merT: 10 Javor: 189  |Depth In: 11387 11430 [Packers: $ - IMud Logger: $
IPH H 9.0 JetVel: 101 IFTG: 43 60 Tanks: $ - ILogging: $ -
IPfIMf: .2/4.5 |ecp: 10.67 |Hrs: 7 6 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 2000 |sPR#1: 62 @555 |FPH: 6.1 10.0  JHeater: $ - |sits: $ 12,500
Ca : 120 |SPR#2: WOB: 35/43 25/32 |Pumping LIT: $ - |Mud Motors: $
Ibapp ppb: 4.1 IBtm.Up: 57 |R-RPM: 65/75 68/72 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: N/A N/A |Mlsc: $ - |consutant: $ 1,000
START | END TIME 0.50 Total Rot. Hre:| 347.0 IDain Total: $ - [oriling Mud: $ 1,460
06:00 | 07:00 1.00 JCONT. REAM & WASH TO BOTTOM IDriIIIng Mud: $ -
07:00 | 07:30 | 0.50 JSLOWLY ESTABLISH NEW PATTERN WITH INSERT BIT. Csg. Crew: $ -
DRILL F/ 11,387' TO 11,388' WITH 2 K ON BIT Daily Total: $49,491
07:30 | 14:00 | 6.50 |DRILL F/11,388' TO 11,430'. ROP =6.5' Cum. Wtr: $ 30,877
14:00 | 14:30 | 0.50 |RIG SERVICE Cum. Fuel $ 112,683
14:30 | 19:00 | 4.50 |POOH FOR BIT Cum. Bits: $ 128,500
19:00 | 23:30 | 4.50 JRIH W/PDC BIT. BREAK CIRC. @ 6,000' BHA
23:30 | 00:00 { 0.50 JREAM & WASH F/ 11,400' TO BOTTOM @ 11,430’ BIT [77/8" 1.00
00:00 | 06:00 | 6.00 |DRILL F/11,430' TO 11,490". ROP = 10’ NBS |6 1/4" 4.37
P 1-DC |6 1/4" 30.84
RECEIVED iBS |7.1/2" 4.97
MAR 1% 2007 1-DC  [6 1/4" 30.79
MEASA VERDE 8904’ IBS 7.50 5.68
CASTLEGATE 11,334’ DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING 15-DCS | 6.25 466.65
DESERT 11,649’
GRASSY 11,739 TOTAL BHA = 544.30
KENILWORTH 12,149’ Survey 21/4 10569
24.00 |TD 12,534 BOILER: 24 HRS |Survey 11/2 11311
P/U 260 K# LITH: BKG GAS 820
S/0 235 K# FLARE: N GAS BUSTER: NO CONN GAS 1521
ROT. 248 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3406' KB PEAK GAS 1204
FUEL Used: 1624 On Hand: — 7192 Co.Man JIM W_ElR — TRIP__GAS 7526
BIT # 8CONDITION[—S3 1 O%5 2 LO¢ i < o e




Energy

GASC

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

O ENERGY

CCNFIDENTIAL

775 RI7E -0y
Y 7~0/3—- 3307 7

GPS N 39* 58.52' W 109* 52.09’

AFE # 40159
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 |Permit Depth:12,580' |Prog. Depth:12,534’ |Date: 3/5/2007 I Days Since Spud: 18
Current Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 11552' |Prgg: 62 D Hrs: 101/2 |AV ROP: 5.9 |Formation: CASTLEGATE
DMC: $3,275 |TMC: $99,304 TDC: $45,275 |CWC: $1,294,174
Contractor:  Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
aw: 10.5 |#1E-10003.5gpm  |Bit#: 10 RR11 [conductor: $ - Jroc,cost: $ -
VIS: 50 SPM: 105 Size: 77/8" 7-7/8" [surt. Csg: $ - IRig Move: $ -
fpviyp: 15/15 Type: HC506ZX+] XS44DR Jint. Csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 9/26/41 |spm: wre: HTC | SEC |prodcse: $ - |Rentaitooss: $ 2,500
WL: 10.4 |cPMm: 369 [siN: 7114781 IFIoat Equp: $ - |rrucking: $
Cake: 1 |press: 1375 Jets: 6X16 3X18  |wel Head: $ - [water: $
Solids: 11.6 JAVDC: 281 1D Out: 115562 TBG/Rods: $ - [Fuel: $
MBT: 10.4 JAvoP: 189 [Depthin: 11430 11552 JPackers: $ - IMud Logger: $
IPH : 9.0 Jetvel: 101 IFTG: 122 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: .2/4.5 |ecp: 10.67 IHrs: 127 Separator: $ - [Cement: $ -
Chior: 2000 |sPr#1: 62 @555 lFPH: 7.7 JHeater: $ - |sits: $ 20,000
Ca : 140 [sPR#2: WOB: 52/36 IPumping ur: $ - ud motors: $
|Dapp ppb: 4.9 IBtm.Up: 59 JR-RPM: 65/75 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |m-Rrewm: N/A NA  Jwise: $ - |consutant: $ 1,000
START END TIME 0.50 Total Rot. Hrs:| 347.0 IDaIIy Total: $ - |prilling Mud: $ 3,275
06:00 | 12:00 | 6.00 |DRILL F/11,489' TO 11,520'. ROP=¥§' IDriIIIng Mud: $ -
12:00 12:30 | 0.50 |RIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: $
12:30 | 17:00 | 4.50 |DRILL F/11,520' TO 11,552". ROP=7.11 Daily Total: $45,275
17:00 | 18:00 | 1.00 |CIRC. WHILE BUILD SLUG. PULL BIT DUE TO INCREASE IN Cum. Wtr: $ 30,877
PUMP PRESSURE & TORQUE. Cum. Fuel $ 112,683
18:00 | 22:30 | 4.50 JSLUG DRILL PIPE & POOH FOR BIT. { BIT RING OUT } Cum. Bits: $ 148,500
22:30 | 00:30 | 2.00 | M/UBIT RR# 10 & RIH TO SHOE & CIRC. BHA
00:30 | 02:00 | 1.50 |SLIP & CUT DRILLING LINE 91’ BIT |[77/8" 1.00
02:00 | 05:30 | 3.50 JRIHTO 11,532' NBS |6 1/4" 4.37
05:30 | 06:00 | 0.50 |WASH & REAM TO BOTTOM SLOWLY @ 11,552’ 1-DC |6 1/4" 30.84
iBS |7 1/2" 4.97
FLARE 8' TO 10' 30 MIN. BOTTOMS UP GAS . — 1\ ;=1 1-DC |6 1/4" 30.79
MEASA VERDE _8904' wEIVED BS | 7.50 5.68
CASTLEGATE 11,334 MAR 0% 2007 15-DCS | 6.25 466.65
DESERT 11,649
GRASSY 11,739' *JF OIL, GAS & MINING TOTAL BHA = 544.30
KENILWORTH 12,149 Survey 2 1/4 10569
24:00 |TD 12,5634’ BOILER: 24 HRS  [Survey 1172 11311
P/U 260 K# LITH: BKG GAS 1045
S/O 235 K# FLARE: N GAS BUSTER: YES CONN GAS 4150
ROT. 248 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3406' KB PEAK GAS 1404
FUEL Used: 1392 On Hand: _ 5800 Co. Man JIM WEIR — TRIP GAS 7588
BIT # 9CONDITION ICZ:BS Ogs gg Lgc XS?1/4$DR CI; ?/:/319 §E RING OUT




GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

GASCO
Energy

CONFIDENTIAL
TS RIVE S~oy
Y3—-013- 330 79
GPS N 39* 58.52' W 109* 52.09'

AFE # 40159
Well: WRF 144-11-17 IPermit Depth:12,580' IProg. Depth:12,534' lDate: 3/6/2007 [ Days Since Spud: 19
Current Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 11643’ |Prog: 91 D Hrs: 121/2 |AV ROP: 7.3 lFormation: CASTLEGATE
DMC: $2,598 |TMC: $101,902 TDC: $38,490 |CWC: $1,332,664
Contractor:  Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 10.5 Im E-10003.5gpm  |Bit#: RR 11 12 Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
vIS: 64 |sPm: 105 Size: 77/8" 7-7/8" |surt. csg: $ - IRig Move: $ -
Ipvryp: 17/31 Type: XS44DR | H506ZX+ |int. Csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 15/35/41 |sPm: IMFG: SEC HTC IProd Csg: $ - IRental Tools: $ 2,500
WL: 9.2 |GPM: 369 |siN: THHEEHHAE 7114779 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 360
Cake: 1 |Press: 1400 Juets: 3X18 6X16 |well Head: $ - Water: $
|solids: 11 Javope: 281 |moout: 11597 TBG/Rods: $ - fFue $13,532
I;IBT: 12 JAavDP: 189 |DepthIn: 11552 11597 JPackers: $ - IMud Logger: $
IPH : 9.0 |Jetvel: 101 IFTG: 45 46 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 2/45 |eco: 11.27 IHrs: 6 1/2| 7 1/2 |separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 2000 |sPr#1: 62 @555 - 6.9 6.1 |Heater: $ - |sits: $
Ca : 100 |sPR#2: - WOB: 35/40 24/25 IPumping ur: 3 - IMud Motors: $
Joapp ppb: 5.1 |Btm.Up: 58 |rR-rRPM: 70/75 60/66 IPrlme Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: N/A N/A IMIsc: $ - |consultant: $ 1,000
START END Tme | 050 Total Rot. Hrs:| 371.0 lDain Total: $ - [orilling Mud: $ 2,598
06:00 | 11:00 | 5.00 |DRILL F/11,652' TO 11,584'. ROP =6.4' lDrilling Mud: $ -
11:00 | 11:30 | 0.50 |RIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: $
11:30 | 13:00 | 1.50 |DRILL F/11,584' TO 11,697". ROP = 8.66' Daily Total: $38,490
13:00 | 17:30 | 4.50 |JPOOH FOR BIT. L/D BIT Cum. Wtr: $ 30,877
17:30 | 22:00 | 4.50 {M/U BIT & RIH, BREAK CIRC. @ 6,000' & RIH TO BOTTOM Cum. Fuel $ 126,215
22:00 | 22:30 | 0.50 |REAM & WASH F/11,587' TO 11,597 Cum. Bits: $ 148,500
22:30 | 06:00 | 7.50 |BREAKIN PDC BIT & DRILL F/11,597' TO 11,643. ROP =6.1 BHA
BIT 77/8" 1.00
NBS |6 1/4" 4.37
FLARE: 3' TO 4' 15 MIN. BOTTOM UP GAS 1-DC |6 1/4" 30.84
IBS [71/2" 4.97
1-DC |6 1/4" 30.79
MEASA VERDE 8904’ RECFI\[FI’) IBS 7.50 5.68
CASTLEGATE 11,334 15-DCS | 6.25 466.65
DESERT 11,649 MAR 5 2007
GRASSY 11,739 e TOTAL BHA = 544.30
KENILWORTH 12,149' . Survey 21/4 10569’
24:00|1D 12,534 BOILER: 24 HRS  |Survey 1172 11311
P/U 260 K# LITH: BKG GAS 570
S/IO 235 K# FLARE:Y GAS BUSTER: YES CONN GAS 851
ROT. 248 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@  3406'KB PEAK GAS 768
FUEL Used: 1392 On Hand: 5800 Co.Man JIMWEIR '@PLGAS 7865
BIT # 11CONDITION—< LS o Lo BE © onc e




GASCO
Energy

GASCO ENERGY

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

CCNFIDENTIAL
T8 RIVE s-0Y

t/3-013—330 7
GPS N 39* 58.52' W 109* 52.09’

AFE # 40159
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 |Permit Depth:12,580" |Prog. Depth:12,534’ |Date: 3/7/2007 I Days Since Spud: 20
Current Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 11711’ IPrgg: 68 D Hrs: 121/2 |AV ROP: 5.4 IFormation: CASTELGATE/DESERT
DMC: $3,087 |TMC: $104,990 TDC: $85,087 |CWC: $1,417,751
Contractor:  Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Imw: 10.5 |#1 E-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 12 13 Conductor: $ - Jroc.cost: $ -
VIS: 48 SPM: 105 Size: 77/8" 7-7/8" |surf. Csg: $ - IRig Move: $ -
IpviYP: 11/23 Type: H506ZX+ | MF45H [int.Csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 15/35/41 |sPMm: |vra: HTC HTC lProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 2,500
WL: 98 |GPM: 369 |siN: HHHHHHHHE PF4180 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $
Cake: 1 |Press: 1 500 Jets: 6X16 3X18 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: 11 |avoc: 281 [loout 11677 11711 [1BG/Rods: $ - JFuet $
MBT: 12 AV DP: 189  Jpepthin: 11652 11677 [Packers: $ - IMud Logger: $
IPH : 9.0 [etvel: 101 IFTG: 125 34 Tanks: $ - lLogging: $ -
IPfIMf: .2/5.8 |ecp: 11.27 IHrs: 14 6 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 2000 |sPr#1: 62 @555 IFPH: 8.9 5.7  [Heater: $ - ]Bits: $60,000
Ca : 100 |sPr#2: WOB: 25/37 25/38 IPumping ur: $ - |mudmotors: $
IDapp ppb: 5  [Btm.Up: 58 |R-RPM: 55/75 65/80 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |w-ReM: N/A NA  |mise: $ - |consuitant $ 1,000
START END TIME 0.50 Total Rot. Hrs:]  389.5 IDaIIy Total: $ - ioriuing Mud: $ 3,087
06:00 | 12:30 | 6.50 |DRILL F/11,643 TO 11,677'. ROP =5.23' IDriIIing Mud: $ -
12:30 13:00 | 0.50 JRIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: $
13:00 | 13:30 | 0.50 |CIRC. & MIX PILL [Daily Total: $85,087
13:30 | 18:00 | 4.50 |SLUG D.P. & POOH DUE TO PRESSURE INCREASE Cum. Wtr: $ 30,877
18:00 | 22:30 | 4.50 |M/UBIT & RIH TO 11,667'. BREAK CIRC. @ 6,000’ Cum. Fuel $ 126,215
22:30 | 23:00 | 0.50 |REAM & WASH F/11,667' TO 11,677'. NO FILL Cum. Bits: $ 208,000
23:00 | 05:00 | 6.00 |DRILL F/11,677' TO 11,711' { DRILL 2' SLOW} ROP = 5.66' BHA
BIT 77/8" 1.00
NBS |6 1/4" 4.37
NO FLARE 1-DC |6 1/4" 30.84
IBS 71/2" 4.97
RECEIVED 1-DC |6 1/4" 30.79
MEASA VERDE 8904’ , iBS 7.50 5.68
CASTLEGATE _ 11,334 MAR U 7 2007 15-DCS | 6.25 466.65
DESERT 11649 BH-O7 DI BAS NG
GRASSY 11,739’ TOTAL BHA = 544.30
KENILWORTH 12,149’ Survey 21/4 10569’
24:00 |TD 12,534 BOILER: 24 HRS  |Survey 1172 11311
P/U 260 K# LITH: BKG GAS 322
S/0 235 K# FLARE:Y GAS BUSTER: YES CONN GAS 851
ROT. 248 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@  3406'KB PEAK GAS 458
FUEL Used: 1044 On Hand: _ 7308 %_Man JIM WEIR — TIM!AS 7925
IT #12CONDITION 31 OLS e Loe 2 S o s




Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

ONFIDERTIAL
T /S RIZE Sov
Y3~013-33079

AFE # 40159 GPS N 39* 58.52' W 109" 52.09'
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 |Permit Depth:12,580 |Prog. Depth:12,534' IDate: 3/8/2007 | Days Since Spud: 21
Current Operations: DRLG
Depth: 11,865 |Prog: 154' |D Hrs: 13 1/2 |AV ROP: 11.4 |Formation: GRASSY
DMC: $2,978 ITMC: $107,969 TDC: $34,978 |CWC: $1,452,729
Contractor:  Frontier Riis Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Jmw: 106 |1 E100035 gpm  |Bit#: 14 Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
vis: 50 |sPm: 106 |size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - IRig Move: $ -
|PviYP: 12/23 Type: FMH 3753 Jint. Csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 15/35/41 |sPM: JvFc: SEC IProd Csg: $ - [Rentai Toots: $ 2,500
WL: 10.2 |GPM: 370 SIN: 10878722 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $
Cake: 1 IPress: 1551 Jets: 6 X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 11 Javbe: 281 [|mpout: TBG/Rods: $ - Jruet: $ -
MBT: 12  Javor: 189 |pepth In: 11,711 IPackers: $ - IMud Logger: $
|PH : 9.0 |Jetvel: 101 IFTG: 154' Tanks: $ - JLogging: $ -
IPf/Mf: .2/6.6 |ECD: 11.1 |Hrs: 13 1/2 Separator: $ - Jcement: $ -
Chlor: 2000 |sPR#1: 60 @550 |FPH: 11.4 JHeator: $ - [sits: $ 10,000
Ca : 100 |sPR#2: WOB: 15/20 IPumpsng ur: $ - |mud motors: $
|Dapp ppb: 53 JBtmup: 59 MIN |r-RPM: 65/70 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: N/A IMIsc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,000
START | END TIME 0.50 Total Rot. Hrs:]  403.0 IDaIIy Total: $ - Joriting Mud: $ 2,978
06:00 | 10:00 { 4:00 |TRIP OUT OF HOLE F/BIT #14, LAY DOWN BIT # 13 IDrilIIng Mud: $ -
10:00 | 15:00 | 5:00 |M/U BIT # 14, TRIP IN HOLE FILL @ SHOE & 7800' Csg. Crow: $
15:00 | 16:00 | 1:00 |WASH & REAM 100' TO BOTTEM, NO FILL Daily Total: $
16:00 | 16:30 | 0:30 |SERVICE RIG Cum. Wtr: $ 30877
16:30 | 06:00 | 13:30 |DRLG F/11,711' T/11,865' (154' @ 11.4 FPH ) Cum. Fuel $ 126,215
Cum. Bits: $ 218,000
BHA
BIT 77/8" 1.00
e T NBS |6 1/4" 4.37
NEVEIVEY 1-DC__|6 1/4" 30.84
MAR 0 8 2007 BS [71/2" 4.97
1-DC |6 1/4” 30.79
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING IBS 7.50 5.68
15-DCS 6.25 466.65
GRASSY 11,739 TOTAL BHA = 544.30
KENILWORTH 12,149 Survey 21/4 10569’
24:00 |TD 12,534’ BOILER: 24 HRS [Survey 11/2 11311
P/U 270 K# LITH: BKG GAS 3516
S/0 245 K# FLARE: GAS BUSTER:YES VENTING, NO FLARE CONN GAS 8324
ROT. 250 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@  3406'KB PEAK GAS 8324
FUEL Used: 1392 On Hand: _ 5916 Cwan Floyd Mitchell o TRIIEAS 5112
BIT #13 COND, |93 1 O%S s Lo o5 S opc i




GASCO
Energy

GASCO ENERGY

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

CONFIDENTIAL
TUS RIIE Soy
Y 3—-0/3-33079

AFE # 40159 GPS N 39* 58.52' W 109* 52.09'
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 |Permit Depth:12,580" |Prog. Depth:12,534' IDate: 3/9/2007 | Days Since Spud: 22
Current Operations: DRLG
Depth: 12,169’ |Pr0£ 304 D Hrs: 231/2 |AV ROP: 12.9 |Formation: KENILWORTH
DMC: $2,887 |TMC: $110,856 TDC: $25,407 |CWC: $1,478,136
Contractor:  Frontier &g 6 Mud Co: M-1 DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Imw: 10.5 |#1 E-1000 3.5 gpm Isit #: 14 Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 49 |sPm: 106 Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - IRIg Move: $ -
lpvivp: 11/26 Type: FMH 3753 {int. Csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 15/35/42 |sPm: |vFa: SEC IProd Csg: $ ~ [Rentat Toots: $ 2,500
WL: 10.4 ]JGPM: 370 |si: 10878722 lFloat Equp: $ - Trucking: $
Cake: 1 Press: 1450 Jets: 6 X 16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 11 Javoc: 281 |0 out: TBG/Rods: $ - [JFuet: $ -
ImBT: 12 Javoe: 189 [pepthin: 11,711 |Packers: $ - IMud Logger: $
IPH : 9.0 JetVel: 101 IFTG: 458' Tanks: $ - ILoggIng: $ -
IPfIMf: .2/5.8 |eco: 11.1 IHrs: 37 Separator: $ - jcement: $ -
Chior: 2000 |spr#1: 60 @525 IFPH: 12.4 JHeator: $ - IBits: $ -
Ca : 100 |sPR#2: WOB: 15/20 IPumpIng ur: $ - |muamotors: $ -
iDapp ppb: 4.9 |Btm.Up: 60 MIN |R-RPM: 65/70 IPrIme Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total DT. |m-RPM: N/A IMisc: $ - [cConsultant: $ 1,000
START | END TIME 0.50 Total Rot. Hrs:|  426.5 IDain Total: $ - |orining Mud: $ 2,887
06:00 | 15:00 | 9:00 |DRLG F/11,865' T/11,997' (132' @ 14.7 FPH) IMlsc ILabor: $ 520
15:00 | 15:30 | 0:30 JSRVICE RIG Csg. Crew: $
15:30 | 06:00 | 14:30 |DRLG F/11,997' T/12,169' ( 172' @ 11.9 FPH ) Daily Total: $ 25,407
Cum. Wtr: $ 30,877
Cum. Fuel $ 126,215
Cum. Bits: $ 21 8,000
BHA
BIT 77/8" 1.00
NBS [6 1/4" 4.37
RFCE!‘.’ED 1-DC |6 1/4" 30.84
IBS |7 1/2" 4.97
MAK U 9 2007 1-DC__|6 1/4" 30.79
DIV AF AL A e o o IBS 7.50 5.68
BN-Or-OiL GAS S MINING 15-DCS | 6.25 466.65
TOTAL BHA = 544.30
KENILWORTH 12,149’ Survey 21/4 10569’
24:00 |TD 12,534’ BOILER: 24 HRS  |Survey 11/2 11311
P/U 270 K# LITH: BKG GAS 4673
S/O 245 K# FLARE: GAS BUSTER:YES 5' TO 10°' FLARE CONN GAS 4972
ROT. 252 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3406' KB PEAK GAS 5770
FUEL Used: 1624 On Hand: _ 4292 Co._Min FIM_Mitchell _ TRIP_?& N/A
BIT #14 COND. ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G 0oDC RP




GASCO

Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

CUNFIDENTIAL
TS RITE S-07
L/3-—a/3- 33097

AFE # 40159 GPS N 39* 58.52' W 109* 52.09'
Well:  WRF 14-4-1117 |Permit Depth:12,580° _|Prog. Depth:12,53¢' __|Date: 3110/2007 | Days Since Spud: 23
Current Operations: DRLG
Depth: 12,465 |Prog: 296’ |D Hrs: 19 IAV ROP: 15.5 IFormation: ABERDEEN
DMC: $6,640 |TMC: $117,496 TDC: $43,797 |CWC: $1,521,933
Contractor:  Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Imw: 11.4+ I#1 E-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 14 Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $
VIS: 47  |sPm: 106 Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - lRig Move: $ -
IPVIYP: 13/20 Type: FMH 3753 Jint. csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 14/33/39 |sPM: MFG: SEC IProd Csg: $ - lRentaI Tools: $ 2,500
WL: 13 GPM : 370 SIN: 10878722 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 1,125
Cake: 1 JPress: 1450 |Jets: 6 X 16 Well Head: $ - fwater: $ -
Solids: 13 Javoc: 281 [out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet $ 14,032
MBT: 12 JAvDP: 189  pepthin: 11,711 JPackers: $ - IMud Logger: $
IPH : 9.0 |etveli: 101 IFTG: 754' Tanks: $ - ILoggIng: $ -
PIMF: .2/5.5 JECD: 11.7 lHrs: 56 Separator: $ - |cement: $ -
Chior: 3000 |spr#1: 55 @525 |FPH: 13.5 JHeater: $ - ]Bits: $ -
Ca : 100 [sPr#2: WOB: 20/28 IPumping ur: $ - IMud Motors: $ -
IDapp ppb: 4.8 IBimup: 62 MIN |R-RPM: 65/70 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: N/A IMisc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME 0.50 ’ Total Rot. Hrs:| 426.5 IDain Total: $ - |orilling Mua: $ 6,640
06:00 | 11:00 | 5:00 |DRLG F/12,169" T/12,250' (81' @ 16.2 FPH ) IMIsc ILabor: $ -
11:00 | 12:00 | 1:00 JCHECK FLOW, MIX & PUMP SLUG Csg. Crew: $
12:00 | 13:00 | 1:00 |TRIP OUT OF HOLE, WELL FLOWING 3" STREAM @ 8000 Daily Total: $ 43,797
13:00 | 14:00 | 1:00 |MIX & SPOT 13.0 PPG PILL TO KILL FLOW, WELL STILL FLOWINjcum. wtr: $ 30877
14:00 | 15:30 | 1:30 |TRIP INHOLE Cum. Fuel $ 140,247
15:30 | 16:00 | 0:30 |WASH & REAM 45' TO BOTTEM, NO FILL Cum. Bits: $ 218,000
16:00 | 06:00 | 14:00 |DRLG F/12/250' T/12,465' (215’ @ 15.4 FPH ) BHA
(BRING MUD WEIGHT UP TO KILL WATER FLOW WHILE DRLG y BIT (778 1.00
NBS |6 1/4" 4.37
RECEIVED 1-DC__|6 1/4" 30.84
ﬂ*R‘H“?OOT iBS [71/2" 4.97
1-DC |6 1/4" 30.79
C e Ol GAS & MINING IBS 7.50 5.68
15-DCS 6.25 466.65
TOTAL BHA = 544.30
ABERDEEN 12,334 Survey 21/4 10569’
24:00 |TD 12,534 BOILER: 24 HRS |Survey 11/2 11311
P/U 275 K# LITH: BKG GAS 4533
SIO 245 K# FLARE: GAS BUSTER:YES 5'TO 10’ FLARE CONN GAS 5092
ROT. 255 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3406' KB PEAK GAS 5092
FUEL Used: 1868 On Hand: 7424 Co. _Mjn Floyd Mitchell — TRIP GAS 5012
BIT #14 COND. ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ObC RP




GASCO
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GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
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GPS N 39* 58.52" W 109* 52.09'

AFE # 40159
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 IPermit Depth:12,580 |Prog. Depth:12,534' IDate: 3/11/2007 I Days Since Spud: 24
Current Operations: TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR LOGS
Depth: 12534’ TD|Prog: 69’ D Hrs: 3 AV ROP: 23.0 IFormation: ABERDEEN
DMC: $10,632 ITMC: $128,128 TDC: $32,632 |CWC: $1,554,565
Contractor:  Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-IDRLG FLUIDS |TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 12.6 |#1 E-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 14 Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 46 SPM: 106 Size: 7 7/8" Surf. Csg: $ - IRig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 16/20 Type: FMH 3753 Jint. Csg: $ - lDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 15/35/41 |sPm: MFG: SEC IProd Csg: $ - IRentaI Tools: $ 2,500
WL: 126 |oPm: 370 Isn: 10878722 lFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 1450 |Jets: 6 X16 Well Head: 3 - Water: $ -
Solids: 135 Javbe: 281 |tmoout: 12534 TBG/Rods: $ - {Fuel: $ -
MBT: 12 |avop: 189 |pepth In: 11,711 Packers: $ - IMud Logger: $
IPH : 9.0 |Jetvel: 101 lFTG: 823' Tanks: $ - ILog_gIng: $ -
mf: 2/55 JECD: IHrs: 59 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 4000 |sPr#: 55 @525 IFPH: 13.9 JHeater: $ - iBits: $ -
Ca : 100 [|sPR#2: WOB: 20/28 IPumping vr: $ - IMud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 55 |[Btmup: 62 MIN R-RPM: 65/70 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: N/A IMIsc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME 0.50 Total Rot. Hrs:| 429.5 IDain Total: $ - Jorilling Mud: $ 10,632
06:00 | 09:00 | 3:00 |DRLG F/12,465' T/12,534' (69' @ 23 FPH ) Misc /Labor: $ -
09:00 | 04:00 | 19:00 |CIRC & COND HOLE, BRING MUD WEIGHT UP SLOWLY TO Csg. Crew: $
KILL WATER FLOW ( FINAL WEIGHT 12.6 PPG) Daily Total: $ 32,632
04:00 | 04:30 | 0:30 JCHECK FLOW, OK, MIX & PUMP SLUG Cum. Wtr: $ 30877
04:30 | 05:00 | 0:30 |TRIP QUT OF HOLE FOR LOGS Cum. Fuel $ 140,247
Cum. Bits: $ 218,000
TD WELL @ 09:00 3/10/2007 BHA
- BIT |77/8" 1.00
RECEIVED NBS |6 1/4" 4.37
MAR-1-2 2007 1-DC |6 1/4" 30.84
IBS 71/2" 4.97
! Ll 1-DC |6 1/4" 30.79
IBS 7.50 5.68
15-DCS 6.25 466.65
TOTAL BHA = 544.30
(MINUS 1 HR FOR TIME CHANGE) Survey 21/4 10569
23:00 [TD 12,534’ BOILER: 23 HRS |Survey 1172 113171
P/U 275 K# LITH: BKG GAS 4533
S/0 245 K# FLARE: GAS BUSTER:YES 5'TO 10' FLARE CONN GAS 5092
ROT. 255 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ __ 3406'KB PEAK GAS 5092
FUEL Used: 1868 On Hand: L7424 Co. Man Floyd Mitchell _ TRIFEAS 5012
BIT #14 COND. ICS 0OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP




CAFIDENTHL

GASCO GASCO ENERGY TS RIE 504
E}i’é’i.—é—}"" DAILY DRILLING REPORT 17/.9—-0/.3" 3 3077
AFE # 40159 GPS N 39* 58.52' W 109* 52.09'
Weli: WRF 14-4-11-17 |Permit Depth:12,580" IProg. Depth:12,534' IDate: 3/12/2007 I Days Since Spud: 25
Current Operations: TRIP IN HOLE FOR LAY DOWN
Depth: 12534' TDIProg: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: 0.0 IFormation: ABERDEEN
DMC: $16,152 ITMC: $144,281 TDC: $54,652 |CWC: $1,609,237
Contractor:  Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Imw: 12.6 |#1 E-1000 3.5 gpm IBit #: 14 Conductor: $ - iLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 50 |sPm: 110 Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - IRIg Move: $ -
Ipvive: 14/24 Type: FMH 3753 Jint. Csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 15/35/40 |sPm: |mra: SEC IProd Csg: $ - |rentai Tools: $ 2,500
WL: 14  |cPMm: 384  |sm: 10878722 [Fioat Equp: $ - Jrrucking: $ -
Cake: 2.5 |Press: 1700 Joets: 6 X 16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 13.5 |avoc: 292  |TD Out: 12534 TBG/Rods: $ - [Fuet: $ -
IMBT: 12 AV DP: 189  |pepth In: 11,711 |Packers: $ - IMud Logger: $
IPH : 9.0 JetVel: 101 IFTG: 823 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ 16,500
P/Mf: .2/5.4 [Eeco: 13.1 IHrs: 59 Separator: $ - |cement: $ -
Chlor: 4000 |spr#1: 55 @525 [Fen: 13.9 [Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
Ca : 100 |sPrR#2: WOB: 20/28 IPumpIng LIT: $ - IMud Motors: $ -
IDapp ppb: 4.7 [IBtm.up: 62 MIN |R-RPM: 65/70 lPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |w-Rem: N/A lMIsc: $ - |consuitant: $ 1,000
START | END TIME 0.50 Total Rot. Hrs:|  429.5 IDain Total: $ - |prilling Mud: $ 16,152
06:00 { 10:00 | 4:00 JCONT. T/TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR LOGS Imisc nabor: $ -
10:00 | 17:30 | 7:30 |R/U PSILOGING LOG WELL, RUN PLATFORM EXPRESS LOGS |csg. Crew: $
FROM TD TO SURF. CSG, LOGGERS TD 12,510 Daily Total: $ 54,652
17:30 { 19:00 | 1:30 |M/U BIT SUB & BIT TRIP IN HOLE TO CSG SHOE Cum. Wtr: $ 30,877
19:00 | 20:00 | 1:00 |SLIP & CUT DRILLING LINE Cum. Fuel $ 140,247
20:00 | 20:30 | 0:30 |FILL PIPE @ SHOE, DRILL STRING PLUGGED W/LCM Cum. Bits: $ 218,000
20:30 | 23:30 | 3:00 |TRIP QUT OF HOLE WET, UNPLUG BIT & FLOAT SUB BHA
23:30 | 06:00 | 6:30 |JTRIP IN HOLE, FILL PIPE @ BHA & CSG SHOE & 8300’ TRIBIT |77/8" 1.00
BS 6 1/4" 4.01
g o e 2y pro—— 17-DCS |6 1/4" 528.46
RECTIVED
MAR 1 2 2007
Ly, OF OIL, GAS & MINING
TOTAL BHA = 544.30
Survey 21/4 10569’
24:00 |TD 12,534’ BOILER: 23 HRS  |Survey 11/2 11311
P/IU 275 K# LITH: BKG GAS N/A
S/0 245 K# FLARE: GAS BUSTER.YES CONN GAS N/A
ROT. 255 Ki# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3406' KB PEAK GAS N/A
FUEL Used: 1868 On Hand: _ 7424 Co. M Floyd Mitchell _ TRIP__GAS N/A
BIT #14 COND. |31 95 oo LOC B2 & SRS e




CCNFIDENTIAL

GASCO GASCO ENERGY TS R1og sof
Energy DAILY DRILLING REPORT Y3~013- %30'77 ) '
AFE # 40159 GPS N 39* 58.52' W 109* 52.09
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 IPermit Depth:12,580° |Pro&Depth:12,534' !Date: 3/13/2007 I Days Since Spud: 26
Current Operations: CEMENT 4 1/2" PRODUCTION CSG
Depth: 12534’ TD|Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 |AV ROP: 0.0 IFormation: ABERDEEN
DMC: $823 |TMC: $145,104 TDC: $322,637 |CWC: $1,931,874
Contractor:  Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-1 DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
IMw: 12.7 I#1 E-1000 3.5 gpm IBit #: Conductor; $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 48 SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - IRIg Move: $ -
PVIYP: 13/22 {GPM: Type: fint. Csg: $ - [Day Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 15/37/43 fspm: iMFG: IProd Csg: $ 274,318 lRentaI Tools: $ 2,500
WL: 20 GPM : SIN: IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 3  [IPress: Jots: Well Head: $ 2,330 |water: $ -
Solids: 18 |avpc: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - JFuer $ -
IMBT: 12 AV DP: iDepth In: JPackers: $ - IMud Logger: $
IPH : 9.0 JetVel: IFTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
leIMf: .2/5.5 JEcD: IHrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 4000 |sPR #1: - JHeater: $ - JBits: $ -
Ca : 100 |SPR#2: WOB: |Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: 4.7 |Btm.Up: |R-RPM: IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |m-rPM: IMIsc: $ - [Consuitant: $ 1,000
START | END TIME 0.50 Total Rot. Hrs:|  429.5 IDain Total: $ 276,648 |prilling Mud: $ 823
06:00 | 09:00 | 3:00 JCIRC & COND HOLE F/LAY DOWN & CSG lMIsc NLabor: $ 3,095
9:00 16:00 | 7:00 |R/U WEATHERFORD LAY DOWN MACHINE, LAY DOWN DP &  |csg. Crew: $ 20,071
BHA, BREAK KELLY, PULL WEAR BUSHING Daily Total: $ 45,989
16:00 | 17:00 1:00 R/ U WEATHERFORD CSG , HOLD SAFTEY MEETING Cum. Wtr: $ 30,877
17:00 | 01:00 | 8:00 JRUN 295 JNTS 4 1/2" P 110 13.5% CSG SET @ 12,469' KB Cum. Fuel $ 140,247
01:00 | 03:30 | 2:30 |CIRC & COND HOLE F/CEMENT Cum. Bits: $ 218,000
03:30 | 04:00 | 0:30 |HOLD SAFTEY MEETING, R/U SCHLUMBERGER BHA
04:00 | 06:00 | 2:00 JCEMENT 4 1/2" PRODUCTION CSG
NOTE: CEMENT JOB INCOMPLETE, CEMENT DETAIL AND RIG
RELEASE TIME AND DATE ON TOMORROWS REPORT
(Y ol ad AW mnd =
nNOCUCTvVeELD
MAR 13 2007
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING TOTAL BHA =
Survey
24:00JTD 12,534’ BOILER: 23 HRS  |Survey
P/U 275 K# LITH: BKG GAS N/A
S/0 245 K# FLARE: GAS BUSTER: CONN GAS N/A
ROT. 255 K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3406' KB PEAK GAS N/A
FUEL Used: 1868 On Hand: 7424 Co. Man Floyd Mitchell _ TRIP_GéS N/A
BIT COND. ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ObC RP
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GASCO GASCO ENERGY .f/, 5 o 19E S0Y
Energy DAILY DRILLING REPORT L7015~ 33097
AFE # 40159 GPS N 39* 58.52' W 109* 52.09"
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 IPermit Depth:12,580’ |Prog. Depth:12,534' IDate: 3/13/2007 | Days Since Spud: 26
Current Operations: RIG DOWN
Depth: 12534’ TDlProgi 0 D Hrs: 0 |AV ROP: 0.0 |Formation: ABERDEEN
DMC: $0 ITMC: $145,104 TDC: $83,922 |CWC: $2,015,796
Contractor: __ Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Jmw: 12.7 |#1 E-10003.5gpm  |Bit#: Conductor: $ - [JLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 48 SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - IRIg Move: $ -
PV/YP: 13/22 |GPM: Type: Jint. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 15/37/43 |sPM: IMFG: IProd Csg: $ - |Renta Tools: $ -
WL: 20 GPM : SIN: IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 3 |Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 18 AV DC: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - JFuet: $ -
IMBT: 12  JavDP: |Depth in: JPackers: $ - IMud Logger: $
IPH : 9.0 |Jetvel: IFTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
Pf/Mf: 2/5.5 |EcD: IHrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ 64,422
Chlor: 4000 |sPR#1: [ren: JHeater: $ - |sits: $ -
Ca : 100 |]sPrR#2: WOB: IPumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
1Dapp ppb: 4.7 IBtm.Up: |R-RPM: lPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: IMIsc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME 0.50 Total Rot. Hrs:| 429.5 IDain Total: $ - JDrilling Mud: $ -
06:00 | 07:30 1:30 |CONT. TO CEMENT 4 1/2" CSG W/SCHLUMBERGER CEMENT IMisc [Labor: $ -
CEMENT DETAIL:PUMP 20 BBLS CW WASH FOLLWED BY 20 Csg. Crew: $ -
BBLS SPACER THAN 1600 SKS 36:65 + ADDITIVES LEAD Daily Total: $ 83,922
CEMENT MIXED @ 13.5 PPG W/1.57 CU/FT SK YIELD THAN Cum. Wtr: $ 30,877
1380 SKS 50/50 POZ "G" + ADDITVES TAIL CEMENT MIXED @ ___|cum. Fuel $ 140,247
14.1 PPG w/1.28 CU/FT SK YIELD DROP PLUG DIPLACE W/185 [Jcum. Bits: $ 218,000
BBLS KCL H20 BUMP PLUG TO 4400 PSI BLEED OFF FLOATS BHA
HELD, GOOD CIRCULATION THRU QUT JOB 3 BBLS CEMENT T(
SURFACE
07:30 | 08:00 | 0:30 JHANG CSG W/ 125K ON HANGER
08:00 16:00 8:00 JCLEAN MUD TANKS
16:00 18:00 2:00 |RIG DOWN
RIG RELEASED @ 16:00 3/13/2007
RECEIVED
MAR1™42007 TOTAL BHA =
DIV-OF-Ol-GAS & MitiNG—fourvey
12:00 |TD 12,534 BOlLER 12 HRS |Survey
P/U K# LITH: BKG GAS N/A
S/0 K# FLARE: GAS BUSTER: CONN GAS N/A
ROT. K# LAST CSG. RAN: 41/2" SET @ 12,469' KB PEAK GAS N/A
FUEL Used: 1868 On Hand: 7424 Co. Man Floyd Mitchell TRII'-‘_(iAS N/A
BIT COND. ICS 0OCS DC LOC B/S G oDC RP




GASCO GASCO ENERGY
Energy DAILY DRILLING REPORT

AFE # 40159 GPS N 39* 58.52' W 109* 52.09’
Well: WRF 14-4-11-17 IPermit Depth:12,580' |PMpth:1 2,534' |Date: 3/15/2007 I Days Since Spud: 28
Current Operations: RIG DOWN
Depth: 12534’ TDIProgi 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: 0.0 IFormation: ABERDEEN
DMC: $0 ITMC: $145,104 TDC: $8,316 |CWC: $2,024,112
Contractor:  Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co:  M-IDRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 12.7 |#1 E-1000 3.5 gpm IBit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 48 SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - IRIg Move: $ -
|PVIYP: 13/22 IGPM: Type: ilnt. Csg: $ - lDay Rate: $ -
Gel: 15/37/43 |sPM: IMFG: IProd Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ -
WL: 20 GPM : SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 3 Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ 7,316
Solids: 18 JAVDC: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - [Fuel: $ -
MBT: 12 JAvDP: Joepth in: Packers: $ - IMud Logger: $
E-I : 9.0 Petvel: IFTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: .2/5.5 JECD: IHrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 4000 |sPR#1: lFPH: iHeater: $ - |sits: $ -
Ca : 100 [sPR#2: WOB: IPumping vt $ - IMud Motors: 3 -
Dapp ppb: 4.7 Btm.Up: |R-RPM: IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: IMIsc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME 0.50 Total Rot. Hrs:|  429.5 lDain Total: $ - |oriliing Mud: $ -
06:00 | 18:00 | 12;00 |RIG DOWN lMisc ILabor: $ -
FINAL REPORT Csg. Crew: $ -
Daily Total: $ 8,316
Cum. Wtr: $ 30,877
Cum. Fuel $ 140,247
Cum. Bits: $ 21 8,000
BHA
RECEIVED
MAR 1 5 2007
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
TOTAL BHA =
Survey
12:00 |TD 12,534’ BOILER: HRS Survey
P/U K# LITH: BKG GAS N/A
S/O Ki# FLARE: GAS BUSTER: CONN GAS N/A
ROT. Kit LAST CSG. RAN: 41/2" SET@ 12,469' KB PEAK GAS N/A
FUEL Used: 1868 On Hand: 7424 Co. Man Floyd Mitchell . TRIIEAS N/A
BIT COND. ICS 0OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP




pPason p~rnni'T Hason systems usa corp.

‘17 1‘,81P9Ta§pie"}\)louﬂtain Parkway « Ste. 100 « Golden » CO « 80403
oA Telephone (720) 880-2000 * Fax (720) 880-0016
www.pason.com

March 14, 2007 <4 WS )T
Oil & Gas Supervisor
Utah Division of Oil, Gas, & Mining
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
RE: GASCO PRODUCTION
WILKIN RIDGE FEDERAL 14-4-11-17
SEC. 4, T11S,R17E
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT
Dear Oil & Gas Supervisor:

Enclosed is the final computer colored log for the above referenced well.

We appreciate the opportunity to be of service to you and look forward to working with you
again in the near future.

If you have any questions regarding the enclosed data, please contact us.
Sincerely,

Bill Nagel

Geology Manager

Pason Systems USA

BN/gdr

Encl: 1 Final Computer Colored Log.

Cc:  Mike Decker, Gasco Energy, Inc., Englewood, CO.

FRECHE NED
N#AR 116622007

DOMLOR.QUL - BGAS.& MINNG



=CTIVED

AUG 2 9 2007
GASCO Production Company

i

N KT SN
Dn.] fﬁ OH‘ CAS & LINTNG

Lease: Wilkin Ridge Federal 14-4-11-17
Legal: SW SW Section 4-T11S-R17E

Duchesne County, Uah CONFIDENTIAL

Drlg CWC: $ 2,024,112

Battery and const est: DC $92075 CC $2,116,187
TOC inside surface csg.

Completion:

4/24/07 Building tk battery and P/L. DC 13,468 CC 2,129,655

5/5/07 Update late costs (SCE) DC 2398 CC $2,132,053
5/11/07 Update late costs (SCE) DC 2081 CC $2,134,134

Completion: Mobe 1 — Entire Wellbore

7/12/07 Tk battery complete and tied into gas sales line. WHI installed frac tree
and tested.
8/14/07 MIRU Superior WS and JW Wireline. RIH and shoot “Perf Only” f/

12045 — 55°, 11872 — 81°. RIH w/ plug and guns to perf Stage 1 — Grassy
/ Desert. Set 10K Solid Comp BP @ 11840°. Perforated f/ 11696 — 99,
11814 — 16°, 11820 — 23°, 3 spf. Broke dn perfs @ 5215 psi @ 4.7 bpm.
ISIP 4800. FG .84. Calc 21 holes open / 24. Hybrid fraced w/ 8500#
20-40 white sd, and 100,700# 20-40 Optiprop, using 98990 gal 20#
linear and x-linked BHT gel. Flushed 2 bbls short w/ 172.5 bbls.
Opened well to FB @ 6;25 PM, on 10/64” ck, w/ 4800 SICP.

8/15/07 SWI 7:40 AM w/ 650 FCP on 16/64” ck. Made 903 bbls in 12.5 hrs. TR
903. BLWTR 1454. RIH w/ plug and guns to perf Stage 2, Lower
Mesaverde. Set 8 K FTFP #2 @ 11290°. Psi tested plug to 4300 psi, ok.
Perforated f/ 11171 - 74°, 11192 - 95°, 11221 - 23°, 11273 - 77’, 3 spf.
Pumped into perfs (no break) @ 4820 psi @ 9.1 bpm. ISIP 4325. FG .82.
Calc 25 holes open / 36. Hybrid fraced Stg 2 w/ 9500# 20-40 white sd
and 119,600 # 20-40 Optiprop, using 113,511 gal (2702 bbls) linear
and x-linked 20# BHT 1 gel. Flushed w/ 165.7 bbls (1 short). ISIP 3925.
FG .78. SWI and RIH w/ plug and guns to perf Stage 3 — Lower
Mesaverde. Set FTFP #3 @ 10868°. Did not Psi test plug due to extreme



8/16/07

8/17/07

lightning storm. Perforated f/ 10573 — 76°, 10658 — 61°, 10713 - 15°,
10756 — 58°, 10850 — 53’, 3 spf. Pumped into perfs (no break) @ 4800
psi @ 10.9 bpm. ISIP 3630. FG .77. Calc 17 holes open /39. Tight. Got
back into frac, and rate was better. Hybrid fraced Stage 3 w/ 12,200#
20-40 white sd, and 137,900# 20-40 Optiprop, using _ gal (_ bbls)
linear and x-linked 20# BHT 1 gel. Flushed w/ 155.75 bbls. ISIP 3770.
FG .78. Opened well up to FB @ 8:15 PM, on 12/64” ck, w/ 3400 SICP.
7:00 AM, 8/15/07, well flg back w/ 2600 FCP on 16/64” ck. Made 1188
bbls in 13 hrs. TR 2091. BLWTR 6175. (SCE) DC

Well flg w/ 1250 FCP on 16/64” ck. Made 1738 bbls in 24 hrs. TR 3829
(46%). BLWTR 4437. (SCE) DC frac 239,656, perf 28,971.50 CC

Put well dn line @ 12:15 PM, 8/16/07, to first sales. Made 220 bbls in 5
hrs. TR 4049. BLWTR 4217. (SCE)

Final Report

8/19/07

8/22/07

8/23/07

8/24/07

8/27/07

Costs, (no 3-C sheet yet) DC 57718 CC

MIRUSU. RU pump and lines. Pump 75 BW down CSG to kill well. Well
would not die. Left well flowing. SDFN. (RM/AWS) DC 7910

FCP=1000#. RU WL. RIH and perf Upper Mesaverde 10022-28" X 9838-
42> w/ 3 SPF. PU X set kill plug at 9800’. POOH. Bleed off CSG
pressure. TIH w/ 3-3/4” chomper bit x POBS w/ float x XN nipple x 126
JTS 2-3/8”, 4.7” N-80 TBG. SDFN. EOT @4095°. (RM/AWS)

DC 6700

Continue TIH w/ 171 JTS TBG, Tag kill plug @ 9800°. RU power swivel.
Pump 40 BW to clear bit. Drill out kill plug. Continue TIH w/ 32 JTS
TBG. Pump 10 BW to clear bit. Drill out FTFP #2 @ 10868°/1 min. Chase
plug to 10930’. Drill up plug. TIH w/ 6 JTS TBG to 11128°. SDFN. Turn
well over to flowback crew. (RM/AWS) DC 8600

FCP=650#, TIH w/ 5 JTS TBG. Tag FTFP #1 @ 11290°. Drill out FTP.
Well stopped flowing. TIH w/ 16 JTS TBG. Tag SD @ 11830°. CIRC out
SD to top of BP @ 11840°. Drill out BP @ 11840’ while pumping @ 2
BWPM. Well still dead. Pump 150 BW @ 2-1/2 BPM to clean out sand
and debris. TIH w/ 12 JTS TBG. Tag PBTD @ 12270’ w/370 JTS TBG.
Pull 1 JT TBG x drop ball. Pump 30 BW to pump off bit x POBS @
3500# @ 12240°. TOH w/ 51 JTS TBG. EOT @ 10555* w/ 318 JTS 2-
3/8” 4.7# N-80 TBG. NDBOP. NUWH. Broach TBG. SDFN (RM/AWS)
DC 8800



8/28/07 RU to swab. I[FL @ 2000°. Made 11 runs x recovered 86 BF. Well kicked
off. Wait 2.5 HRS. Well flowing @ 16 BF/HR. FTP = 250# on 20/64”
CHK. CP=100#. Tum well over to flowback crew. RDSU. (RM/AWS)
DC 6780



Form 3160-

UNITED STATES

FORM APPROVED

1April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No 1004- 0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March 31, 2007
S. Lease Senal No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-76032
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. 1f Indian. Allottee_ or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. 1 Unit or CA. Apreement Name and/or No
1 Type of Well Y , NA
Oil Well Gas Well I:IOIhcr LON F, UENT'A 4 5! Well Name and No.

2 Name of Operator

Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal 14-1-11-17
9 API Well No.

3a Address

8 Inverness Drive Last Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112

b Phone No imclude area code)

305-483-0044

43-013-33099

10, Field and Pool. or Exploratory Area

4 Location of Well (I-ootuge. Sec .

1. R AL or Survey Descriprion)

856’ FSL & 752' FWL SW SW of Section 4-THIS-RI7E

Wildcat

I, County or Parnish. State

Duchesne County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

l:INolicc of Intem

Subscqucm Report

DFinal Abandonment Notice

DACldize
DAllenng Casing
I:](‘asing Repar
Dt'hange Plans
D(‘unven to Ingection

I:]I deepen
I:Il-mclurc Treat
DNC\\ Construction
DPIug and abandon
Dl’hlg back

Pmduclmn( Start/ Resume)
I:]Redammion
DRccomplclc

D'I emporanly Abandon
DWaler Disposal

DWalcr Shut-of¥
DWeII Integnty
I:l()lher

13. Descnbe Proposed or Completed Operations {clearly state all pertinent detarls. including eshmated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal 1s to deepen directionally or recomplete honzontally | pive subsurface tocations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No - on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
Tollowing completion of the involved operations I the operation results 0 a multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval. a Form 3160-4 shafl be filed once
testing has been completed  Tinal Abandonment Notices shall be filed ondy alter all requirements. including reclamation, have been completed. and the operator has

determined that the site isready lor final inspection

This well was started on production on 8-22-07

14 1 hereby centify that the forepoing is true and correct

Name (Primied  Typed)

Tnle

Engineering Technician

Beverly Walker
!

Date

August 222007

}

Signature ‘/
™ ‘\h_’(_\ e s\ ‘ \ \{ 4 “&—\

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by

Title

Date

Conditions of approval_ if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant onf

certifv that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights i the subject lease]Office

which  would  entitlethe

apphcant 1o

condugct

operations

thereon

States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its junsdiction

DA
Tile 18 USC Section 1001 AND Title 43 tJ S.C Sechon 1212, inake it a crime for any person knowmngly and willfully to make any depanm&n'hhﬁm

(Insiructions e page 2)

AUG 3T 2007

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



UNITED STATES

Form 3160- §
{April 2004)

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM APPROVED
OMB No 1004- 0137
Expires March 31. 2007

S. Lease Serial No
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-76032
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian. Allottee. or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. INUnitor CA. Agreement Name and/or No
1 Type of Well NA
O Well (;as Wwell D()lhe! 8  Well Name and No

2 Name of Operator Wilkin Ridge Federal 14-4-11-17

9. APl Well No

Gasco Production Company

3a Address
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112

3b  Phone No. finclude arca code)

43-013-33099

10, Field and Pool. or Exploratory Area

303-483-0044

4. Locaton of Well thootage. Sec . 1R AL or Swvey Description)

856" FSI. & 752" FWIL. SW SW of Section 4-T1

Wildcat

County or Pansh. State

T
IS-RI7E

Duchesne County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATIE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

D/\cuhzc Dl)cepcn
I:l/\llcnng Casing
D(‘asnm Repair
D('hange Plans

D(‘l»nven to Imection

Nom’c of Intent
DSubscqucnl Repon

I:] Plug back

I:]anl Abandonment Notice

[:IFraclme Treat
D New Construction
|:|Plug and abandon

[’Walu Shut-oft
DWC" Integrnity
D()lhel

Dl’roduchon { Start/ Resume)

D Reclamation

D Recomplete
D'l‘empomnl_v Abandon
Waler Disposal

Descnbe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearty state all pertinent details, including estimated stanting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof

M the proposal 15 to decpen directionalty or recomplete honzontally. give subsurface focations and measured and true venical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be hiled within 30 days

following completion of the involved operations

Il the operation results 1n 2 multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval. a Fonm 3160-4 shall be filed once

testing has been completed  Final Abandonment Notiees shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed and the operator has

determined that the site 1s ready for final inspection

This is to inform you that we will be disposing of water from this well as follows:

All produced water from this well will be ty

‘ucked off the location and disposed of at

the Desert Spring State Evaporation Facility NW 1/4 of Section 36-T9S-R18E
Uintah County Utah. Which is owned by Gasco Production Company. A copy of
Gasco's approved permit 1s attached for your records.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Cil. Gas and Mining

14 | hereby certify that the foregomp s true and comect
Name (Primted Typed)

FOR-RECORB-ONLY

Title
Beverly Walker ) Cngineering Technician
Signature 1 : Date
"IN U Lo b August 22, 2007
R ! THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE
Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval. if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant orf
certify that the apphcant holds legal or cquitable tile 10 those nghts n the subject lease]

which  would entitle  the applicant 1o conduct  operations  thereon.

Office

States any false, ficitiousor fraudulent statements of representations as to any imatter within

Title 18 U S C Section 1001 AND Title 43 1S C Section 1212 nake it a crune for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department OF :I%IE_ tlbﬁE}ad

its Jurisdiction. a

{Instructions on page 2)

AUGTT 2007

DIV.OF OIL, GAs & MINING



Form 3160- § UNITED STATES Fo'c m‘!ngENTIAl

(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No 1004- 0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March 31. 2007
S. Lease Senal No
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-76032
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian. Allottee. or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7 IfUnitor CA Amﬂm Name andor No

1 Type of Well

D()nl well Gas Well D()lhw 8. Weil Name and No

2 Name of Operator Wilkin Rld;:’C Federal 14-4-11-17

Gasco Production Company 9 APl Well No

la Address 3b. Phone No (mclnde area code) 43-013-33099
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10 Ficld and Pool. or Exploratory Area
4 Locatton of Well 1/ ootage. Sec. 1.0 R A or Survey Description) Wildcat

It County or Pansh. State

856" IFSL & 752 FWL SW SW of Section 4-T11S-R17E

Duchesne County. Utah
i2. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Nnhcc of Imem D/\cidizc Dl)ccpen I:]Pmduclmn( Start/ Resume) I:]Wmcv Shut-of?
D/\llcnng Casing Dl:raclme Treat DReclammum DWcll Integnity
DSul)scqucnl Repon D(‘asmg Repair DNew Construction DRecomplclc ()Ihcl

D('hange Plans I___JPlug and abandon D'l‘cmpomnly Abandon EFM Meter

I:Il-'mal Abandonment Notice D('onvcn to Injection I:]Plug back DWalcr Disposal

13 Desenbe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details. including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal 1s to decpen directionally or recomplete honzontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following compietion of the involved operations. If the operation results in 2 multiple completion or recompletion ma new interval. a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
teshing has been completed  Final Abandonment Notices shall be hled only after all requrements. including reclamation. have been completed. and the operator has
determined that the site 1s ready for final inspection

This sundry is being sent to inform you that we will be using a Ferguson Beauregard EFM
(Model 3500) to measure production from this well and will be considered as the point of
sale for guas produced from this well. A temperature probe has been installed for gas
measurement purposes. This unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected
and proved according to all BLM regulations.

poreotid DY e

2 ivision o .
i) ?‘V‘%‘%‘“ - Federal Approval Of This
0Oil, Gas an Action Is Necassary

FH0 CrRERAIGR

: Datej
(M
14 1 hereby certity that the forepoing is true and correct
Name (Prmted Tvpedy
Tule
Beverly Walker Engineering Technician
Signature - N ) Date
WD e Lol L ke August 22,2007
‘ ! THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE
Approved by Tile Date

Conditions of approval. if any are attached Approval of this notice does pot warrant o]

certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable tile to those rights n the subject leasejOffice
which  would  entile  the  applicanl  to  conduct _ operations thereon RF{‘_F"[

Title 18 U SC Section 1001 AND Title 43 US C. Section 1212, make t a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any departmemt or agency nf'lh'e%g

States any lalse, fictitiousor fraudulent slatements or representations as 1o any matter within its junsdiction
{Instructions on puge 2) -

DIV. OF OIL, GAs & MINING




NOTICE
Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-21 states that,

> A well is considered completed when the well has been adequately worked to be capable
of producing oil or gas or when well testing as required by the division is concluded.

> Within 30 days after the completion or plugging of a well, the following shall be filed:

Form 8, Well Completion or Recompletion Report and Log

A copy of electric and radioactivity logs, if run

A copy of drillstem test reports,

A copy of formation water analyses, porosity, permeability or fluid saturation
determinations

A copy of core analyses, and lithologic logs or sample descriptions if compiled

A copy of directional, deviation, and/or measurement-while-drilling survey for
each horizontal well

Failure to submit reports in a timely manner will result in the issuance of a Notice of Violation
by the Division of Qil, Gas and Mining, and may result in the Division pursuing enforcement
action as outlined in Rule R649-10, Administrative Procedures, and Section 40-6-11 of the
Utah Code.

As of the mailing of this notice, the division has not received the required reports for

Operator: _Gasco Production Company Today’s Date: 09/18/2007
Well: API Number: Drilling Commenced:
Federal 14-31-9-19 wer 4304736271 01/11/2007
Wilkin Ridge Fed 14-4-11-17 wer 4301333099 02/10/2007
Wilkin Ridge Fed 43-29-10-17 drig/wcr 4301333098 02/20/2007
Federal 12-1-10-18 wer 4304737646 03/21/2007
Federal 12-30-9-19 drig/wcr 4304737613 04/18/2007
Gate Cyn ST 23-16-11-15 drig/wcr 4301332685 04/25/2007
Sheep Wash Fed 14-25-9-18 wer 4304737647 05/03/2007
Federal 32-20-9-19 drigiwcr 4304736094 05/10/2007

To avoid compliance action, required reports should be mailed within 7 business days to:
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801
If you have questions or concerns regarding this matter, please call (801) 538-5284.

cc: Well File
Compliance File



Fomn 3160-4 UNITED STATES CON i!:l B b N FORM APPROVED

(August 195%) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR L“ ilisim _ OMBNO. 1004-0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000
WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG 5. Lease Serial No.
UTU-76032
la. Type of Well 0 oil went & Gas D Dry  Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
b. Type of Completion: 2 New O work over [ Deepen [ PlugBack [} Diff. Resvr. NA
Other 7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.

o NA
2. Name of Operator 8. Lease Name and Well No.
Gasco Production Company Wilkin Ridge Federal 14-4-11-17
3. Address 3a. Phone No. finclude area code)

9. API Well No.
8 Inverness Drive East Suite 100, Englewood. Colorado 80112 303-483-0044 43-013-33099
4. Location of Well (Report locations clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements) *

10. Field and Pool. or Exploratory

At surface 856' FSL, 752' FWL Wildcat
11. Sec..T., R., M., or Block and
At top prod. interval reported below same Survey or Areca  SWSW 4-11S17E
12. County or Parish 13. State
At total depth same S N1161 Uintah Utah
14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16. Date Complete; N 17. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)*

4/2 D& A h Ready to Prod.

02/10/07 03/11/07 KB: 6409' GL: 6387
18. Total Depth: MD 12534 19. Plug Back T.D.. MD 12270' 20. Depth Bridge Plug Set: MD NA
TVD 12534’ TVD 12270 TVD NA
21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy of each) 22, Was well a No D Yes (Submit copy)
GR, Cal, CBL, M NV Mol Di D, N Was DST run? No [ Yes(Submit copy)
/ y DG, G B :
Directional D No O ves (Submit copy)

23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)

Hole Size | Size/Grade | Wt (#/ft) Top (MD) Bottom (MD) StageDCe'e;;enler Tl;;;: Z?it;z“ Sh:gé:/)d' Cement Top* Amount Pulled
17 172" |13 3/8 H4{ 484 9 210 Cire to Surf
12 1/4" |8 5/8 J-55 324 0 3355' 485sx of Class G Circ to Surf
720sx of Class G
77/8" |41/2 P11} 13.54 0 12534" 1600sx of 36:65 Cire to Surf
1380sx of 50/50poz(
24. Tubing Record
Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) | Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) | Packer Set (MD)
25. Producing Intervais 26. Perforation Record
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status
A) Blackbawk 11649 12534' See Attached
R) Mesaverde 8904’ 11334'
C) Wasatch 4829' 8904’
D)
E)
27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc.
Depth Interval Amount and type of Material
See Attached
28. Production - Interval A
Date First  {Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced  |Date Tested Production |BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity
—> Flowing
Choke Tbg. Press.  Csg 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr. AP]
st —>
28a.
Date First | Test Hours Test Ol Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced |Date Tested Production |BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity
Choke Tbg. Press. Csg 24 Hr. Ol Gas Water Ot Grawvity Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr. API
sl —>

(See instructions and spaces for additional data on reverse side)




28b.

Date First |Test Hours Test Ol Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced |Date Tested Production  |BBL MCF BBL Corr. AP]
08/17/07] 08/20/07 24 > 0 433 258
Choke Tbg. Press.  |Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas : Ol Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

St 927 | —> 0 433 258
28c. Production - Interval E
Date First [Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced |Date Tested Production  |BBL MCF BBL Corr. API
Choke Tbg. Press.  |Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

sI —>
29. Disposition of Gas (Sold, used for fuel, vented, etc.)

Sold

30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem
tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures
and recoveries.

Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name L Top
Meas. Depth
Wasatch 4,829 8,904
Mesaverde 8,904 11,334
Blackhawk 11,649 12,534]TD's in Blackhawk

32. Additional remarks (include plugging procedure):

33. Circle enclosed attachments:
1. Electrical/Mechanical Logs (1 full set req'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Report 4. Directional Survey
5. Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification S. Core Analysis 7. Other:

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

Beverly Walker Title Engineering Technician

Name (please print,

Signature { //Z,LA/ Q/@/O\ Date 10/5/2007

Title 18 U.S.C". Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

o US. GPO: 1999-573-624



27. Perforation Record

Wilkin Ridge Federal 14-4-11-17
Additional Information to Well Completion Report

Pertforated Interval Size  No. Hole] Perf. Status
12045-55; 11872-81; 11696-99; 11814-16; 11820-23 0.38 24 Open
11171-74; 11192-95; 11221-23; 11273-77 0.38 36 Open
10573-76; 10658-61; 10713-15; 10756-58; 10850-53 0.38 39 Open
0.38 Open

28. Acid Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc (continued)

Depth Interval

Amount and Type of Material

11696-11823

Hybrid Frac w/ 8500# 20/40 white sd and 100,700# 20/40 OptiProp, using 98,990 gal 20# linear and x-linked
BHT Gel

11171-11277

Hybrid Frac w/ 9500# 20/40 white sd and 119,600# 20/40 OptiProp, using 113,511 gal linear and x-linked 20#
BHTI1 Gel

10573-10853

Hybrid Frac w/ 12,200# 20/40 white sd and 137,900# 20/40 OptiProp using linear and x-linked 20# BHT1 Gel




!‘-s

Form 3160- § UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004- 0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007
5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-76032
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well, Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. 1 Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.
1. Typeof Well NA

Don Well DOther

8. Well Name and No.

Gas Well
2. Name of Operator

Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal 14-4-11-17
9.” API Well No.

3a. Address
8 inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112

3b. Phone No. (include area code)
303-483-0044

43-013-33099
10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R, M., or Survey Description)

856' FSL & 752 FWL SW SW of Section 4-T11S-RI7E

Wildcat
11. County or Parish, State

Duchesne County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

DAcidize
DAlten'ng Casing
DCasing Repair
DChange Plans

Notice of Intent

D Subsequent Report

DFinal Abandonment Notice

D Deepen

DF racture Treat
DNew Construction
DP]ug and abandon
E]Conveﬂ to Injection DPlug back

DProducﬁon ( Start/ Resume)

DReclamation
D Recomplete

DTemporarily Abandon

DWater Disposal

DWater Shut-off
D Well Integrity

Other Site Security

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including

estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof

If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, 2 Form 3160-4 shall be filed once

testing has been completed. Final-Abandonment Notices shall be filed onl

determined that the site isready for final inspection.

y after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

Please find attached a copy of the site security diagram for this well.

RECEIVED
DEC 15 2008
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

14. Thereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.

Name (Printed’ Typed)
Titl
Jessica Berg e Production Clerk
<
Signature Date
December 11, 2008
j THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE
Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant o1

certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease] Office

conduet

which  would  entitle  the applicant _ to

operations

thereon

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its Jjurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)
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¢ Note: This Site
Security Plan is on
file at the Gasco
Field Office.

Unlabeled
300 gallon

9 bbl (30" x 10"
Horizontal
Separator

&

Meter

To Field

POSITION OF VALVES AND USE OF SEALS DURING PRODUCTION
VALVES LINE PURPOSE POSITION  SEAL INSTALLED

b Drain Closed Yes
F Qil, Gas, Water  Open No
e} Overflow Open/Closed No
v Vent Open No
R Recycle Closed Yes
H Heat Open No
$  Sales Closed =~ Yes

POSITION OF VALVES AND USE OF SEALS DURING SALES
VALVES LINE PURPOSE POSITION  SEAL INSTALLED

D Drain Closed Yes
F Oil, Gas, Water  Closed Yes
o Overflow Closed Yes
\' Vent Open No
R Recycle Closed Yes
H Heat Closed No
8 Sales Open No

POSITION OF VALVES AND USE OF SEALS DURING WATER DRAIN
VALVES LINE PURPOSE POSITION  SEAL INSTALLED

D Drain Open No
F Oll, Gas, Water  Closed No
(o] Overflow Closed No
A\ Vent Open No
R Recycle Closed Yes
H Heat Closed No
S Sales Closed Yes

300 bbl
(12'x 15"
WIT

300 bbl
(12' x 15"

36' X 58' X 15" Earthen Berm

Truck Loading Area

o

Drip Catch

el

Head

BuUYs & ASSOCIATES, INC.
ENVIRONMENTAL CONSULTANTS

LEGEND
D - Drain Valve
F - Flow Valve
O - Overflow
V - Vent
R - Recycle
H - Heat Trace

S - Sales Valve

Gasco Production Company

Lease UTU # 76032
- SW/SW Sec. 4 T11S R17E .
Duchesne County, Utah
October 2008

Wilkin Ridge Federal # 14-4-11-17




| 4
United States Department of the Interior k—

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT TAKeE PRIDE’
Utah State Office INAMERICA
P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
http://www.blm.gov/ut/st/en.html

IN REPLY REFER TO: RECE[VED
3160 JUN 25 2010
(U-922) : JUN 21 2010

e

DIV, OF OlL, GAS & MINING

GASCO Production Company
8 Inverness Drive East

Suite 100

Englewood, CO 80112-5625

Re:  Non-Paying Well Determination
14-4-11-17 Well, Wilkin Ridge Unit
Duchesne County, Utah
Gentlemen:
Pursuant to your request of June 21, 2010, it has been determined by this office that under
existing conditions the following well is not capable of producing unitized substances in paying
quantities as defined in Section 9 of the unit agreement.
API Number Well Name Location Comp. Date Lease

4301333098 14-4-11-17 SWY:SW'e Section4 T11S R17E SLB&M 08/17/2007 UTU76032

All past and future production from this well shall be handled and reported on a lease basis.

Sincerely,
/s/ Roger L. Bankert

Roger L. Bankert
Chief, Branch of Minerals



API Well No: 43013330990000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-76032

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WILKIN RIDGE DEEP

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43013330990000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
EIGHT MILE FLAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:

0856 FSL 0752 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: SWSW Section: 04 Township: 11.0S Range: 17.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
DUCHESNE

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
!/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [} cHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [] cHANGE TuBING [} cHANGE WELL NAME
1/7/2011
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
[] SUBSEQUENT REPORT [ peepen [J FRACTURE TREAT [] NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE !/ WATER DISPOSAL
[] DRILLING REPORT [0 waTER sHuTOFF [0 s1TA sTATUS EXTENSION [0 app ExTENsION
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER:

state approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 30, 2 south

to the currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose of
water from this well.

Range 4 west in North Blue Bench UT. This facility would be used in addition

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Gasco would like to dispose of water at Integrated Water management, LLC

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

Date:__ 12/30/2010

By: L.

)

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Roger Knight 303 996-1803 EHS Supervisor
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 12/29/2010

RECEIVED December 29, 2010




NATIONAL 5YSTEM OF PUOLIC LANDS
U5, DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
KUREAU OF LAND MANKGENENT

United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
440 West 200 South, Suite 500
Salt Lake City, UT 84101

&
http://www.blm.gov/ut/st/en.html &; \§9
7 oS

IN REPLY REFER TO: FEB 0 5 2013 *&
3180 (UTUS1153X) \
UT-922000

Ms. Frankie L. Martinez

Gasco Energy, Inc.

7979 East Tufts Avenue, Suite 1150
Denver, Colorado 80237

Re:  Automatic Contraction
Wilkin Ridge (Deep) Unit
Uintah and Duchesne Counties, Utah
Dear Ms. Martinez:

Your letter of January 24, 2013, describes the lands automatically eliminated effective September 17,
2012, from the Wilkin Ridge (Deep) Unit Area, Uintah and Duchesne Counties, Utah, pursuant to
Section 2(e) of the unit agreement and requests our concurrence. The lands you have described
contain 44,447.23 acres, more or less, and constitute all legal subdivisions, no parts of which are

included in the Wilkin Ridge (Deep) Participating Areas "A” and “ B". As a result of the automatic
contraction, the unit is reduced to 480.00 acres. :

The following Federal Leases are entirely eliminated from the unit area:

UTUS56947 UTU75084 UTU77063 UTUS88144
UTU68387 UTU75085 UTU78214 UTU88204
UTU68620* UTU75086 UTU78215

UTU74400 UTU75087 UTU78216

UTU74401 UTU75088 UTU80950

UTU74402 UTU75235 UTU81003*

UTuU74403 UTuU75236 UTU81706*

UTU74407 UTU75514 UTU82704

UTU74408 UTU75515 UTU82705

UTU74836 UTuU75672 UTU84262 Tract No. 43 UNLEASED*
UTU74968 UTU76031 UTU84263

UTU74971 UTU76032 UTU84264

UTU75079 UTU76256 UTU84265

UTU75080 UTU76258 UTU88068

UTU75081 UTU76716 UTU88069

UTU75082 UTU76717 UTU88072

*Indicates non-committed lease



The following Federal Leases are partially eliminated from the unit area:

UTU65632 UTU75083

You have complied with the requirements of Section 2(e), provided you promptly notify all
interested parties. If you have any questions, please contact Judy Nordstrom at (801) 539-4108.

Sincerely,
Myw Z Bankr

Roger L. Bankert
Chief, Branch of Minerals

Enclosure
cc: UDOGM
- SITLA

ONRR w/Exhibit “B” (Attn: Nancy McCarthy)
(UTGO1) BLM FOM - Vernal w/enclosure



United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

 Utah State Office
440 West 200 South, Suite 500
Salt Lake City, UT 84101

IN REPLY REFER TO:

3160 (UTUB9823X) g
(UT-922000) JUN 112014
Memorandum

To: Assistant Field Office Manager Minerals,

Vernal Field Office
From: Chief Branch of Minerals

Subject: Pre-Existing Wells in the Deseret Unit,

Duchesne and Uintah Counties, Utah.

The following producing gas wells are included in the Deseret

Unit, Duchesne and Uintah Counties.
COMPLETION
API WELL NO LOCATION LEASE DATE
4301332674 | 12-4-11-17 | SWNW Sec. 04 T11.05 R17.0E SLB&M | UTU-75235 | 10/28/2006
4301332778 32-08 SWNE Sec. 08 T11.0S RI17.0E SLB&M | UTU-75672 3/16/2006
4301333099 | 14-4-11-17 | SWSW Sec. 04 T11.0S8 RI17.0E - SLB&M | UTU-76032 8/17/2007

All three wells were determined not capable of producing unitized
substances in paying quantities as defined by the Wilkin Ridge
Unit Agreement.

All past and future production from these wells shall be handled
and reported on a lease basis. If you have any questions, please
contact Mickey Coulthard of this office at (801) 539-4042.

/S/ Becky J. Hammond

File - Deseret Unit

Division of 0il Gas and Mining
UT950 - Central Files

UT920 - Reading File

Agr. Sec. Chron.

Tickler (August, 2014)

bcc:

MCoulthard:mc:6-10-14



Division of Qil, Gas and Mining

Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 4/16/2015

FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERATOR:

Gasco Prodcution Company N2575 Badlands Production Company N4265

7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500 7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500

Denver, CO 80237 Denver, CO 80237

303-996-1805 303-996-1805

CA Number(s): Unit(s):Gate Canyon, Wilkin Ridge Deep, RBU-EOR-GRRV
WELL INFORMATION:

Well Name Sec [TWN [RNG [API Entity Mineral |Surface |[Type Status
See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION:

1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2015
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2015
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 1454161-0143

REVIEW:

1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 6/2/2015
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: N/A

3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/3/2015

4. OPS/SI/TA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 1/20/2016

5. UICS on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: N/A

6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: None

7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): N/A
NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:

1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: SUR0027842

2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A

3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): SUR0027845

DATA ENTRY:

1. Well(s) update in the OGIS on:

2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on:

3. Unit(s) operator number update in OGIS on:

4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on:

5. State/Fee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on:
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on:

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:

SUR0035619 -FCB

1/22/2016
1/22/2016
1/22/2016
N/A
1/22/2016
N/A

1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 1/22/2016

COMMENTS:

1/22/2016



From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

Well Name Section |TWN |RNG |API Number |Entity |Mineral |Surface |Type |Status
FEDERAL 23-18G-9-19 18 090S | 190E 4304752496 Federal Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 14-17G-9-19 17 090S |190E |4304752522 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 13-18G-9-19 18 090S |190E 4304752538 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 23-29G-9-19 29 090S |190E |4304752544 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 24-20G-9-19 20 090S |190E 4304752545 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 31-21G-9-19 21 090S |190E 4304752546 Federal |Federal OW |APD
Federal 323-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753026 Federal Federal GW |APD
Federal 421-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753027 Federal |Federal | GW |APD
Federal 322-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753029 Federal |Federal GW |APD
Federal 431-29-9-19 29 090S |190E [4304753030 | Federal |Federal GW |APD
Federal 432-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753031 | Federal Federal GW |APD
Federal 414-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753070 Federal |Federal GW |APD
FEDERAL 412-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753073 Federal |Federal GW |APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753076 Federal |Federal | GW |APD
federal 321-29-9-19 29 090S |190E|4304753078 Federal |Federal (GW |APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S | 190E 4304753079 Federal |Federal GW |APD
FEDERAL 321-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753080 Federal |Federal GW |APD
Federal 212-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753133 Federal |Federal GW |APD
State 321-32-9-19 32 090S |190E |4304754479 State State |GW_|APD
State 423-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754480 State State |GW |APD
State 421-32-9-19 32 090S |190E |4304754481 State State |GW_|APD
State 413-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754482 State State |GW |APD
State 323-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754483 State State |GW |APD
State 431-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754529 State State |GW |APD
Desert Spring State 224-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304754541 State State |GW |APD
Desert Spring State 243-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304754542 State State |GW |APD
Desert Spring State 241-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304754543 State State |GW APD
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304753012 |19650 Federal |Federal | GW |DRL
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 100S |170E 4301333098 (15941 |Federal |Federal (GW |OPS
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 090S |190E 4304736915 {16556 |Fee Fee GW _|OPS
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S |180E 4304738573 17201 |Federal Federal |(GW |OPS
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304739777 |18344 |[Federal Federal GW |OPS
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S |190E 4304739800 [17202 |Federal Federal GW |OPS
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 110S |150E 4301332391 13787 |State State |GW [P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 100S |170E 4301332447 114033 |State State |GW_|P
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 110S |150E 4301332475 |14417 State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 100S |170E 4301332560 [14726 |Federal |Federal | GW |P
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 110S |160E 4301332611 14439 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332619 15649 |State State |GW [P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 124-11-17 4 110S |170E|4301332674 |15537 |Federal |Federal GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 100S |170E|4301332676 |15242 |State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 100S |170E 4301332679 14033 |[Federal |Federal  GW |P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 16 110S |150E 4301332685 [16082 State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 100S |170E 4301332730 |15243 |State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 100S |170E 4301332773 |15370 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 8 110S [170E 4301332778 14802 Federal |Federal | GW [P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 1110S |160E 4301332888 15098 |State State |GW P
|WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 100S [170E|4301333081 |15714 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 100S |170E 4301333087 ;15807 [Federal |Federal \GW |P
|WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 110S [170E|4301333099 ;15920 Federal |[Federal GW [P
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 110S |140E 4301333437 |16919 Federal |Federal | GW |P
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 i 24 110S !140E 4301333443 /16367 Federal [Federal GW |P
SQUAW CROSSING U 5 2 100S |180E 4304730129 16266 |State State |OW [P
RBU 5-11D 11 100S |180E 4304730409 9005 |Federal Federal OW P |
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 090S | 180E 4304730624 (9030 |Federal |Federal |OW |P




From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU 6-2D 2 100S [180E 4304731190 |7075 |State |State |OW |P
NGC 33-18J 18 090S |190E 4304731200 |6155 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
RBU 13-2D 2 100S |180E 4304731280 |16267 |State  |State |OW |P
RBU 16-3D 3 100S |180E 4304731352 |16268 [Federal |Federal OW |P
RBU 10-11D 11 100S |180E 4304731357 |7053 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
RBU 8-10D 10 100S |180E 4304731364 (4955 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
RBU 15-3D 3 100S |180E 4304731539 |9965 |Federal |Federal OW |P
RBU 12-12D 12 100S [180E 4304731651 |10688 |Federal |Federal OW |P
RBU 2-10D 10 100S |180E[4304731801 {10784 |Federal |Federal | OW |P
RBU 3-15D 15 100S |180E [4304733600 |13213 [Federal |Federal  OW |P
RBU 3-12D 12 100S |180E [4304733739 |14492 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
STATE 7-36A 36 090S |180E|4304733741 14244 State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 34-29 29 090S |190E|4304733750 |13174 Federal Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 100S |180E 4304733983 |13182 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 090S |[190E|4304734111 113441 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 24-20-9-19 20 090S |190E 4304734168 |14150 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FED 44-20-9-19 20 090S | 190E 4304734169 |14140 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S |190E 4304734199 |13601 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304734201 |13641 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 42-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304734202 |13455 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 100S |170E [4304734286 |13492 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
STATE 4-32B 32 090S |190E[4304734314 |14440 State  |State |GW |P
FED 14-18-2 #1 18 100S | 180E 4304734539 13491 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 100S |170E |4304734551 |13726 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 090S |190E 4304734607 113640 Federal |Federal |GW [P
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S |190E 14304734608 [14151 Federal |Federal (GW |P
FED 22-30-10-18 30 100S |180E 4304734924 [14280 [Federal |Federal (GW |P
FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304735343 14202 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 11-22-9-19 22 090S |190E|4304735404 [14203 Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 42-21-9-19 21 090S |190E[4304735405 {14928 |Federal |Federal GW |P
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 090S |190E[4304735588 |14418 |State | Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S |190E 4304735606 |14441 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 090S |190E|4304735614 |14442 Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 090S |190E (4304735623 114640 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304735624 14419 |Federal |Federal [GW |P
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 090S |190E|4304735732 14496 |Fee Fee |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 090S |190E|4304735733 14519 |Fee Fee |GW |P
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 100S |180E 4304735808 |15592 |[Federal Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 100S |190E 4304735844 14356 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304735845 |14639 |State  |State |GW |P
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 090S |190E|4304735995 |14871 State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S |190E 4304736093 |14976 |Federal |Federal |(GW |P
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S |190E[4304736094 [16120 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304736095 |14872 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 090S |180E 4304736113 |15096 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304736219 |14738 |State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304736220 (14763 State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304736233 |14764 State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304736241 |14992 [State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S |180E (4304736242 |14716 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 090S |190E|4304736271 15884 Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304736336 |15086 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304736368 |15605 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304736442 |15715 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304736600 14977 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304736719 |15186 Federal Federal | GW |P




From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company

Effective Date: 4/16/2015

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 125 090S |180E 4304736727 !15475 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304736739 |15476 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304736740 |15213 |Federal |Federal [GW |P
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S |190E|4304736771 |15355 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 090S | 180E 4304736772 |15338 [Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 30 090S ' 190E (4304736817 15212 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 090S |190F 4304736913 |15187 |Fee Fee |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 090S |190E 4304736916 (17012 |Fee Fee |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304737115 |15011 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 090S |190E (4304737116 |16163 Federal |Federal (GW |P
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 090S 190F 4304737117 |16275 |Federal [Federal |GW [P
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180F 4304737132 |15087 |State  |State |GW [P
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S |180F 4304737338 15365 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304737611 [16311 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S |190F 4304737612 16051 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304737613 (16052 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S (190E 4304737621 |16253 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S |190F [4304737622 |16264 Federal Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304737630 |16557 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S |180F 4304737631 15961 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S |180F 4304737646 16023 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S '180F |4304737647 16121 |Federal [Federal GW |P
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S |180E 4304737676 16254 State  |State |GW P
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 100S |180F 4304737677 |15806 |State  |State |GW |P
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S |180E 4304738028 |16868 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S | 190F |4304738336 (16467 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 090S |190F [4304738337 16119 |[Federal |Federal GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S |180E 4304738351 |16884 |Federal [Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304738352 |16349 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S |180F 4304738353 16210 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S | 190F |4304738407 16236 |Federal |Federal GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 090S |180F 4304738465 16558 |[Federal |Federal GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304738469 |16449 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S |190E |4304738575 |16312 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S | 190F |4304738673 115832 |Fee Fee |GW [P
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 11 100S |180E 4304738896 16792 Federal |Federal GW P
STATE 21-32B 32 090S |190E 4304739170 |16309 |State  |State |GW |P
STATE 22-32A 32 090S '190E 4304739171 /16308 [State  |State |GW |P
STATE 21-32A 32 090S '190F [4304739172 [16310 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S |190F [4304739717 |17054 Federal |[Federal |GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304739729 |17241 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304739730 (17266 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 1 100S |180E |4304739773 (17013 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S |190E 4304740233 |17014 |[Federal Federal |GW [P
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S |190E 14304751280 |18211 |Federal |Federal | OW |P
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304751281 |18210 |[Federal |Federal | OW |P
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190 4304752870 {19647 |[Federal |Federal GW |P
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S |190F 4304752872 |19648 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19 ] 30 090S |190E 4304753011 |19649 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S |180F (4304753324 [19783 |State  |State |GW |P
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S |180F 4304753325 |19783 |State  |State |GW |P
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S |180F |4304753326 19747 |State  |State |GW |P
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304753327 |19747 |State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S |180F 4304753328 '19783 [State  |State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S '170E[4301332677 |15144 |State  |State |GW S
RBU 4-11D 11 100S |180E 14304730718 |16269 |Federal |Federal (OW [S




From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU 2-11D 11 100S |180E |4304730826 116270 |[Federal |Federal OW |S
RBU 6-11D 11 100S |180E 4304731192 16271 |Federal |Federal OW |S
STATE 2-32B 32 090S |190E 4304732221 |11371 State  |State |GW_|S
STATE 9-36A 36 090S |180E |4304732225 |11364 |State  |State |GW |S
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S |190E 4304733581 |13249 |Federal |Federal |GW |S
STATE 13-36A 36 090S |180E|4304733598 17838 |State  |State |GW |S
FEDERAL 16-26A - 26 090S |180E 4304733601 |12928 |Federal 'Federal | GW |S
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S |190E 4304733653 13077 |[Federal Federal (GW |S
RBU 1-10D 10 100S |180E|4304734312 [16265 |[Federal |Federal OW 'S
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S |190E 4304739776 (17149 Federal |Federal GW |S




STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU-76482

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

®. IFINDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WEL
Y owwew [J

GAS WELL OTHER

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

Desert Spring Fed 21-1-10-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:

9. API NUMBER:

Gasco Production Company 4304737631
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10, FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDGAT-
7979 E. Tufts Ave. crry Denver s1are CO 580237 (303) 483-0044 Uteland Butte
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FooTAGES AT sURFAce: 0633 FNL 1512 FWL county: Uintah

QTR/AQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 1 108 18E S STATE: y

TAH
. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION _ TYPE OF ACTION
[ aciize [J oeeren [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

2] nNoTiCE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) [ Arercasing

Approximate date work will start [[] casingrepar

4/16/2015

[] crance TueinG

[] suBseQUENTREPORT  |[T] cHaNce weLL NAME

(Submit Originat Form Only)

Date of work completion:

[C] converT weLL Type

[ cHance To PREVIOUS PLANS

[] cHance weLL sTaTUS
[C] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS

[[] eracture TrReAT

[C] ~ewconsTRucTION

[/] oPeraTOR CHaNGE

[ Puucanp ABanDON

[ ruseack

[] ProDUCTION (STARTRESUME)

[J RecLAMATION OF WELL SITE

[C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

[[] sibETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
[J TeEmPORARILY ABANDON
] rtueinc Repair

[J venrorFLare

[ warter bisposaL

] waTER sHuT-OFF

1 omer:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco Production Company requests a change of operator on this well, in addition to the wells on the attached list from Gasco
Production Company to Badlands Production Company, effective date of 4/16/2015.

Gasco Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite 11
Denver CO 80237

303-996-1805 M i

Michael Decker, Exec. Vice President & COO

Badlands Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite,115
Denver CO 80237
303-996-1805 -

Michael Decker, Exec. Vicd President & COO

RECEIVED
JUN 02 2015

DIV, QF OIL, GAS & MINING

APPROVED

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) LjLndsey C°°ks rme Engineering Tech
SIGNATURE ‘ ( ﬁl@/ oate 9/18/2015
(This space for State use only)
JAN 2 2 2016
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

| V. OlL GAS & MINING -
BYWM\&



Well Name

FEDERAL 332-30-9-19

WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19

FEDERAL 12-17-9-19

GATE CYN 31-21-11-15

WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15

WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16

WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-11-17
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08

GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17
RYE PATCH FED 22-21

RYE PATCH FED 24-21

RBU 5-11D

FEDERAL 7-25A

RBU 6-2D

NGC 33-18)

RBU 13-2D

RBU 16-3D

RBU 10-11D

RBU 8-10D

RBU 15-3D

RBU 12-12D

RBU 2-10D

RBU 3-15D

RBU 3-12D

STATE 7-36A

FEDERAL 34-29
FEDERAL 24-7 #1

FEDERAL 23-29 #1

FED 24-20-9-19

FED 44-20-9-19

FED 23-21-9-19

FED 32-31-9-19

FED 42-29-9-19

PETES WASH 23-12 #1

STATE 4-32B

FED 14-18-2 #1

FED 43-24-3 #1

LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19

FED 11-21-9-19

FED 22-30-10-18

FEDERAL 43-30-9-19

FED 11-22-9-19

FED 42-21-9-19

STATE 24-16-9-19

Section TWN
30 090S
29 1008
23 0908
26 0908
19 090S
17 090S
21 1108
32 1008
20 1108
17 1008
19 1108
32 1008
4 1108
32 1008
29 1008
16 1108
16 1008
29 1008
8 1108
16 1108
20 1008
20 1008
4 1108
22 1108
24 1108
11 1008
25 0908
2 1008
18 090S
2 1008
3 1008
11 1008
10 100S
3 1008
12 100S
10 1008
15 1008
12 1008
36 090S
29 0908
7 1008
29 090S
20 090S
20 090S
21 090S
31 090S
29 090S
12 1008
32 090S
18 1008
24 1008
22 0908
21 0908
30 1008
30 090S
22 090S
21 090S
16 090s

RNG
190E
170E
190E
180E
190E
190E
1S0E
170E
150E
170E
160E
170E
170E
170E
170E
150E
170E
170E
170E
160E
170E
170E
170E
140E
140E
180E
180E
180E
190E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
170E
190E
180E
170E
190E
190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E

API

4304753012
4301333098
4304736915
4304738573
4304739777
4304739800
4301332391
4301332447
4301332475
4301332560
4301332611
4301332619
4301332674
4301332676
4301332679
4301332685
4301332730
4301332773
4301332778
4301332888
4301333081
4301333087
4301333099
4301333437
4301333443
4304730409
4304730624
4304731190
4304731200
4304731280
4304731352
4304731357
4304731364
4304731539
4304731651
4304731801
4304733600
4304733739
4304733741
4304733750
4304733983
4304734111
4304734168
4304734169
4304734199
4304734201
4304734202
4304734286
4304734314
4304734539
4304734551
4304734607
4304734608
4304734924
4304735343
4304735404
4304735405
4304735588

Entity
19650
15941
16556
17201
18344
17202
13787
14033
14417
14726
14439
15649
15537
15242
14033
16082
15243
15370
14802
15098
15714
15807
15920
16919
16367
9005

9030

7075

6155

16267
16268
7053

4955

9965

10688
10784
13213
14492
14244
13174
13182
13441
14150
14140
13601
13641
13455
13492
14440
13491
13726
13640
14151
14280
14202
14203
14928
14418

Mineral
Federal
Federal
Fee
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
State
Federal
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State

Surface Type

Federal
Federal
Fee
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
State
Federal
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal

Federal
State

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal

GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
GwW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW

Status

335532

e Mia- e - B - B - e~ Mia - Mie - Mia- Mo - M - e - Bl - M - B - Bia - Bin - Mie - M - Bhe - e~ M- B - Miet - B - e - e - Mia - M - B - ke - Mia - M- B - B - Bin - e - Mia - M - B - e - ke - M - M - Bin - Mia - Ml - M - Mk - ke - Ml -



FEDERAL 31-21-9-19
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19

LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19

DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18
STATE 12-32-9-19

FEDERAL 12-20-9-19
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19

LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19

DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18

FEDERAL 12-1-10-18

SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19

21
29
31
31
22
14
22

36
32
20
20
30
26
36
36
36
36
36
31
31
31
31
25
19
25
30
25
19
25
30
22
14
36

1008
1008
090S
090S

090S
090S
0908
1008
100S

100S
100S
100S

0908

090S
090S

090S
090S
090S

190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
180E
190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
180E
190E
180E
190E
180E
190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
180E
190E
190E
180E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
190E
190E
180E
180E
180E
190E
180E
180E
190E

4304735606
4304735614
4304735623
4304735624
4304735732
4304735733
4304735808
4304735844
4304735845
4304735995
4304736093
4304736094
4304736095
4304736113
4304736219
4304736220
4304736233
4304736241
4304736242
4304736271
4304736336
4304736368
4304736442
4304736600
4304736719
4304736727
4304736739
4304736740
4304736771
4304736772
4304736817
4304736913
4304736916
4304737115
4304737116
4304737117
4304737132
4304737338
4304737611
4304737612
4304737613
4304737621
4304737622
4304737630
4304737631
4304737646
4304737647
4304737676
4304737677
4304738028
4304738336
4304738337
4304738351
4304738352
4304738353
4304738407
4304738465
4304738469
4304738575

14441
14442
14640
14419
14496
14519
15592
14356
14639
14871
14976
16120
14872
15096
14738
14763
14764
14992
14716
15884
15086
15605
15715
14977
15186
15475
15476
15213
15355
15338
15212
15187
17012
15011
16163
16275
15087
15365
16311
16051
16052
16253
16264
16557
15961
16023
16121
16254
15806
16868
16467
16119
16884
16349
16210
16236
16558
16449
16312

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Fee
Fee
Federal
Federal
State

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Fee
Fee
State
Federal
Federal
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Fee
Fee
Federal
Federal
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Fee
Fee
State
Federal
Federal
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal

GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
Gw
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
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LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18
STATE 21-32B

STATE 22-32A

STATE 21-32A

FEDERAL 11-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID)
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19

Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18

22
11
32
32
32
19
25
25
I

19
30
19
30
30
30
36
36
36
36

DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36

WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17
SQUAW CROSSING U §
RBU 4-11D

RBU 2-11D

RBU 6-11D

STATE 2-32B

STATE 9-36A
FEDERAL 13-30B
STATE 13-36A
FEDERAL 16-26A
FEDERAL 31-29

RBU 1-10D

FEDERAL 13-18-9-19

32
2

11
11
11
32
36
30
36
26
29
10
18

090S
100S
090S
090S
090S
090S
090S
090S
100S
090S
090S
090S
090S
090S
090S
090S
090S
090S
0908
090S
100S
1008
100S
1008
1008
090S
0908
0908
090S
0908
090S
100S
090S

190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
180E
180E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
170E
180E
180E
180E
180E
190E
180E
190E
180E
180E
190E
180E
190E

4304738673
4304738896
4304739170
4304739171
4304739172
4304739717
4304739729
4304739730
4304739773
4304740233
4304751280
4304751281
4304752870
4304752872
4304753011
4304753324
4304753325
4304753326
4304753327
4304753328
4301332677
4304730129
4304730718
4304730826
4304731192
4304732221
4304732225
4304733581
4304733598
4304733601
4304733653
4304734312
4304739776

15832
16792
16309
16308
16310
17054
17241
17266
17013
17014
18211
18210
19647
10648
19649
19783
19783
19747
19747
19783
15144
16266
16269
16270
16271
11371
11364
13249
17838
12928
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