STATE OF UTAH FORM 3

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
AMENDED REPORT [ ]

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING (highlight changes)
T 5. MINERAL LEASE NO.: 6. SURFACE:
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL UTU-75083 BLM
1A TYPE OF WORK. DRILL m REENTER D DEEPEN l:] 7. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
N/A
B TveeoFwel: OL[T] GAS[X]  OTHER SINGLEZONEXT ~ MULTIPLE ZONE [T | & UNIT of CAAGREEMENT NAME:
Wilkin Ridge
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gasco Production Company Wilkin Ridge Federal #24-20-10-17
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Drive East, Suite #100, Englewood, CO 80112 303-483-0044 Eight Mile Flat
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) Dgztg ZY 3[) ’ (a 2 2 5) / 11 &LEII(:JR SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE
AT SURFACE: 491' FSL and 1789' FWL Sec. 20, T10S-R17E
AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONE: SE SW - ) 10.0 3 yes
Y195 h5
14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:
Approximately 24.4 miles south of Myton, UT. Duchesne UTAH
15. DISTANCE TO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE (FEET) 16. NUMBER OF ACRES IN LEASE: 17. NUMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:
491' 1917.68 40 Acres
18. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING, COMPLETED, OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:
APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET):
1200' 13,050' Bond No. UT-1233
21. ELEVATIONS (SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATE DATE WORK WILL START: 23. ESTIMATED DURATION:
6105' GL ASAP 35 Days
2 PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT | SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY, YIELD, AND SLURRY WEIGHT
17-1/2" 13-3/8", H-40, 48# 200' 200 sx Premium Type 5, 15.6 ppg, 1.18 yield
12-1/4" 8-5/8", J-55, 32# 3,820' |652 sx Hi-Lift, 11 ppg, 3.91 yield + 185 sx 10-2 RFC, 14.2 ppg, 1.63 yield
7-7/8" 4-1/2", P-110, 13.54% 13,050' | 523 sx Hi-Lift, 11.5 ppg, 3.05 yield & 1344 sx 50/50 Poz, 14.1 ppg, 1.28 yield
T EE UL TIGHT HOLE

25. ATTACHMENTS

VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES:

WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLING PROGRAM

EVIDENCE OF DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER D FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANY OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

AGENT: PermitCo Inc. AGENT'S PHONE NO.:  303-857-9999
Venessa Langmacher me Agentfor Gasco Production Company

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)
SIGNATURE EIRQ, M/‘& (%WW/% ﬂ / DATE 2/21/2006  *Revised 8/10/06

(This space for State use only)

API NUMBERASSIGNED:#?-- 0f 5 - 55&2/ APPROVAL: RECEEVED

T d by the .
AU?tra,rr\oS?vi::igm of AUG 1 4 2006

Oil, G 5"\‘@1\*‘“’3 L 2DV OF OIL GAS & i

(11/2001) ' 'o’m'.
Action I8 Necessary Dat




Ti0S, RiI7E, S.L.B.&M.

SB9'56'W — 5258.88" (G.L.0.)

NOO'O3'W — 2640.00° (G.L.O.)

1910 Bross

Cap, ’;7_9 High,
Pie of Stone
A—

WILKIN RIDGE FEDERAL

NOOOO20°E — 2636.65" (Msas.)

NOO'03'W — 5280.00" (G.L.O.)

GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

Well location, WILKIN RIDGE FEDERAL
#24-20-10—-17, located as shown in the SE 1/4

SW 1/4 of Section 20, T10S, R17E, S.L.B.&M.
Duchesne County, Utah.

BASIS OF ELEVATION

SPOT ELEVATION LOCATED IN THE SW 1/4 OF SECTION 20,
T10S, R17E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE WILKIN RIDGE,
QUADRANGLE, UTAH, DUCHESNE COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTE QUAD.
(TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL SURVEY. SAID
ELEVATION IS MARKED AS BEING 6275 FEET.

BASIS OF BEARINGS
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.
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SCALE

THIS 1S TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVES £
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS M@ 'S
SUPERVISION AND THAT THE SAMESNRNZS

1789' #24—-20—-10-17
Elev. Ungraded Ground = 6105’
o -
< h
- - REVISED: 03-06-06 X
NB9S2'16°E — 2616.61° (Meas.) 1910 BrassNB9'S5'E — 2632.74" (G.L.0.) - 0F \fi Ve
1910 Bross Cop, Flush U E i
Cop, 2.0 High, w, INTAH KENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
Pre of Stord Pl of Stones
85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078
LEGEND: (AUTONOMOUS NAD 83) (435) 789-1017
s LATITUDE = 39'55'24.67" (39.923519) SCALE DATE SURVEYED:  |DATE DRAWN:
L - g0 symBoL LONGITUDE = 110°01°59.51" (110.033197) 1" = 1000’ 09-21-05 09-27-05
(AUTONOMOUS NAD 27) PARTY REFERENCES
@ - PROPOSED WELL HEAD. LATITUDE = 39°55'24.80" (39.923556) JW. CW LK. G.L.O. PLAT
A = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGITUDE = 11001°56.97" (110.032492) WEATHER FILE
WARM GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY




CONFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1

Approval of Operations on Onshore
Federal and Indian Oil & Gas Leases

Wilkin Ridge Federal #24-20-10-17
491' FSL and 1789' FWL
SE SW Section 20, T10S - R17E
Duchesne County, Utah

Prepared For:
Gasco Production Company
By:

PERMITCO INC. e

14421 County Road 10 o '»_E\:-‘.i

Ft. Lupton, Colorado 80621 AR
303/857-9999 Y W

Copies Sent To:

3 - Bureau of Land Management - Vernal, UT

1 - Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining - SLC, UT
2 - Gasco Production Company - Englewood, CO
1 - Shawn Elworthy - Roosevelt, UT




ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CONFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal #24-20-10-17 Lease No. UTU-75083
491' FSL and 1789' FWL

SE SW Section 20, T10S - R17E DRILLING PROGRAM
Duchesne County, Utah Page 1

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore
Federal and Indian Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made with applicable
laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, and the approved plan of operations. The
operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished
the field representative to insure compliance.

1. ESTIMATED TOPS OF IMPORTANT GEOLOGIC MARKERS

Formation Depth Subsea
Wasatch 4,980' 1.030'
Mesaverde 9,190' -3,180'
Castlegate 11,800’ -5,790'
Blackhawk 12,070’ -6,060'
Aberdeen 12,750’ -6,740'
T.D. 13,050' -9,100'

2. ESTIMATED DEPTH OF ANTICIPATED WATER, OIL, GAS OR MINERAL FORMATIONS:

Substance Formation Depth
Gas Wasatch 5,100' - 9,190’
Gas Mesaverde 9,190' - 11,800'
Gas Blackhawk 12,070' - 12,950'

All fresh water prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling, will be recorded
by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested to determine
commercial potential.

]
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ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CONFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal #24-20-10-17 Lease No. UTU-75083
491' FSL and 1789' FWL

SE SW Section 20, T10S - R17E DRILLING PROGRAM
Duchesne County, Utah Page 2

3. PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT

Gasco Production Company’s minimum specifications for pressure control equipment are as follows:
Ram Type: 11" Hydraulic double with annular, 5000 psi w.p.

Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved stack working pressure
if isolated by test plug or to 70 percent of internal yield pressure of casing. Pressure shall be
maintained for at least 10 minutes or until requirements of test are met, whichever is longer. If a test
plug is utilized, no bleed-off pressure is acceptable. For a test not utilizing a test plug, if a decline in
pressure of more than 10 percent in 30 minutes occurs, the test shall be considered to have failed.
Valve on casing head below test plug shall be open during test of BOP stack.

Annular type preventers (if used) shall be tested to 50 percent of rated working pressure. Pressure
shall be maintained at least 10 minutes or until provisions of test are met, whichever is longer.

As a minimum, the above test shall be performed:

a when initially installed;

b. whenever any seal subject to test pressure is broken
c following related repairs; and

d

at 30-day intervals

Valves shall be tested from working pressure side during BOPE tests with all down stream valves
open.

When testing the kill line valve(s) the check valve shall be held open or the ball removed.
Annular preventers shall be functionally operated at least weekly.

Pipe and blind rams shall be activated each trip, however, this function need not be performed more
than once a day.

A BOPE pit level drill shall be conducted weekly for each driliing crew.

Pressure tests shall apply to all related well control equipment.

PERMITCO
oy paxs”



ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CUNFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal #24-20-10-17 Lease No. UTU-75083
491' FSL and 1789' FWL

SE SW Section 20, T10S - R17E DRILLING PROGRAM
Duchesne County, Utah Page 3

All of the above described tests and/or drills shall be recorded in the drilling log.

BOP systems shall be consistent with AP RP53. Pressure tests will be conducted before drilling out
from under casing strings which have been set and cemented in place. Blowout preventer controls
will be installed prior to drilling the surface casing plug and will remain in use until the wellis completed
or abandoned. Preventers will be inspected and operated at least daily to ensure good mechanical
working order, and this inspection will be recorded on the daily drilling report. Preventers will be
pressure tested before drilling casing cement plugs.

The District Office should be notified, with sufficient lead time, in order to have the BLM representative
on location during pressure testing.

a. The size and rating of the BOP stack is shown on the aftached diagram. Although arig has
not been chosen to drill this well, most of the equipment for this depth of hole in the area use
a 11", 5000 psi working pressure blowout preventor.

b. A choke line and a kill line are to be properly installed. The kill line is not to be used as a
fill-up line.
C. The accumulator system shall have a pressure capacity to provide for repeated operation of

hydraulic preventers.

d. Drill string safety valve(s), to fit all tools in the drill string, are to be maintained on the rig floor
while drilling operations are in progress.

4, PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM:

a. The proposed casing and cementing program shall be conducted as approved to protect
and/or isolate all usable water zones, potentially productive zones, lost circulation zones,
abnormally pressured zones, and any prospectively valuable deposits of minerals. Any
isolating medium other than cement shall receive approval prior to use. The casing setting
depth shall be calculated to position the casing seat opposite a competent formation which
will contain the maximum pressure to which it will be exposed during normal drilling

(-]
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ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CONFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal #24-20-10-17 Lease No. UTU-75083
491' FSL and 1789' FWL

SE SW Section 20, T10S - R17E DRILLING PROGRAM
Duchesne County, Utah Page 4

operations. Determination of casing setting depth shall be based on all relevant factors,
including; presence/absence of hydrocarbons; fracture gradients; usable water zones;
formation pressures; lost circulation zones; other minerals; or other unusual characteristics.
All indications of usable water shall be reported.

b. Casing design shall assume formation pressure gradients of 0.44 to 0.50 psi per foot for
exploratory wells (lacking better data).

c. Casing design shall assume fracture gradients from 0.70 to 1.00 psi per foot for exploratory
wells (lacking better data)

d. Casing collars shall have a minimum clearance of 0.422 inches of all sides in the hole/casing
annulus, with recognition that variances can be granted for justified exceptions.

e. All waiting on cement times shall be adequate to achieve a minimum of 500 psi compressive
strength at the casing shoe prior to drilling out.

f. All casing except the conductor casing, shall be new or reconditioned and tested used casing
that meets or exceeds API standards for new casing.

g. The surface casing shall be cemented back to surface either during the primary cement job
or by remedial cementing.

h. All indications of usable water shall be reported to the authorized officer prior to running the
next string of casing or before plugging orders are requested, whichever occurs first.

i Three centralizers will be run on the bottom three joints of surface casing with a minimum of
one centralizer per joint starting with the shoe joint.

j. Top plugs shall be used to reduce contamination of cement by displacement fluid. A bottom
plug or other acceptable technique, such as a suitable preflush fluid, inner string cement
method, etc. shall be utilized to help isolate the cement from contamination by the mud fluid
being displaced ahead of the cement slurry.

k. All casing strings below the conductor shall be pressure tested to 0.22 psi per foot of casing
string length or 1500 psi, whichever is greater, but not to exceed 70 percent of the minimum
internal yield. If pressure declines more than 10 percent in 30 minutes, corrective action shall
be taken.

@
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ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CONFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal #24-20-10-17
491' FSL and 1789' FWL

SE SW Section 20, T10S - R17E

Duchesne County, Utah

Lease No. UTU-75083

DRILLING PROGRAM
Page 5

l. On all exploratory wells, and on that portion of any well approved for a 5M BOPE system or
greater, a pressure integrity test of each casing shoe shall be performed. Formation at the
shoe shall be tested to a minimum of the mud weight equivalent anticipated to control the
formation pressure to the next casing depth or at total depth of the well. This test shall be
performed before drilling more than 20 feet of new hole.

m. The proposed casing program will be as follows:
Purpose Depth Hole Size | 0.D. Weight | Grade | Type | New/Used
Conductor 0-200' 17-12" | 13-3/8" 484 H-40 New
Surface 0-3,820' 12-1/4" 8-5/8" 32# J-55 ST&C New
Production 0-13,050' 7-7/8" 4-1/2" 13.5# P-110 | LT&C New
n. Casing design subject to revision based on geologic conditions encountered.
0. The cement program will be as follows:
Conductor Type and Amount
0-200' 200 sx Premium Type 5 mixed @ 15.6 ppg, 1.18 yield
Surface Type and Amount
0-3,820' Lead: 652 sx Hi-Lift mixed @ 11 ppg, 3.91 yield
Tail: 185 sx 10-2 RFC mixed @ 14.2 ppg, 1.63 yield
Production Type and Amount
TOC @ 2,500' Lead: 523 sx Hi-Lift mixed @ 11.5 ppg, 3.05 yield
Tail: 1344 sx 50:50 Poz mixed @ 14.1 ppg, 1.28 yield
p. Anticipated cement tops will be reported as to depth; not the expected number of sacks of

cement 1o be used. The District Office should be notified, with sufficient lead time, in order
to have a BLM representative on location while running all casing strings and cementing.

[}
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ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CONFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal #24-20-10-17 Lease No. UTU-75083

491' FSL and 1789' FWL

SE SW Section 20, T10S - R17E DRILLING PROGRAM

Duchesne County, Utah Page 6
q. After cementing but before commencing any test, the casing string shall stand cemented until

the cement has reached a compressive strength of at least 500 psi at the shoe. WOC time
shall be recorded in the driller's log.

r. The following reports shall be filed with the District Manager within 30 days after the work is
completed.

1. Progress reports, Form 3160-5 (formerly 9-331) "Sundry Notices and Reports on
Wells", must include complete information concerning:

a. Setting of each string of casing, showing the size, grade, weight of casing
set, hole size, setting depth, amounts and type of cement used, whether
cement circulated or the top of the cement behind the casing, depth of
cementing tools used, casing test method and results, and the date work
was done. Show the spud date on the first reports submitted.

b. Temperature or bond logs must be submitted for each well where the casing
cement was not circulated to the surface.

S. Auxiliary equipment to be used is as follows:
1. Kelly cock
2. No bit float is deemed necessary.
3. A sub with a full opening valve.

5. MUD PROGRAM

a. The proposed circulating mediums to be employed in drilling are as follows:
Interval Mud Type Mud Wt. Visc. F/L pH
0 - 200' Fresh Water 8.33 1 --- 7
200' - 3,820' Fresh Water 8.33 1 --- 7-8
3,820' - 13,050' Fresh Water/DAP 9.0-11.5 | 30-40 | 12-20 8

W
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ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CUNFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal #24-20-10-17 Lease No. UTU-75083
491' FSL and 1789' FWL

SE SW Section 20, T10S - R17E DRILLING PROGRAM
Duchesne County, Utah Page 7

There will be sufficient mud on location to control a blowout should one occur.

A mud test shall be performed every 24 hours after mudding up to determine, as applicable:
density, viscosity, gel strength, static filtration loss, and Ph.

Mud monitoring equipment to be used is as follows:

1. Periodic checks will be made each tour of the mud system. The mud level will be
checked visually.

No chromate additives will be used in the mud system on Federal and/or Indian lands without
prior BLM approval to ensure adequate protection of fresh water aquifers.

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA Title I1l in an amount equal to or greater than
10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in
association with the drilling of this well. Furthermore, no extremely hazardous substances,
as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities, will be used, produced, stored,
transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling of this well.

The use of materials under BLM jurisdiction will conform to 43 CFR 3610.2-3.

6. EVALUATION PROGRAM

The anticipated type and amount of testing, logging and coring are as follows:

a.

No drill stem tests are anticipated, however, if DST's are run, the following requirements will
be adhered to:

Initial opening of drill stem test tools shall be restricted to daylight hours unless specific
approval to start during other hours is obtained from the authorized officer. However, DST's
may be allowed to continue at night if the test was initiated during daylight hours and the rate
of flow is stabilized and if adequate lighting is available (i.e. lighting which is adequate for
visibility and vapor-proof for safe operations). Packers can be released, but tripping shall not
begin before daylight, unless prior approval is obtained from the authorized officer. Closed
chamber DSTs may be accomplished day or night.




ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CONFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal #24-20-10-17 Lease No. UTU-75083
491' FSL and 1789' FWL

SE SW Section 20, T10S - R17E DRILLING PROGRAM
Duchesne County, Utah Page 8

A DST that flows to the surface with evidence of hydrocarbons shall be either reversed out
of the testing string under controlled surface conditions. This would involve provided some
means for reverse circulation.

Separation equipment required for the anticipated recovery shall be properly installed before
a test starts.

All engines within 100 feet of the wellbore that are required to "run" during the test shall have
spark arresters or water cooled exhausts.

b. The logging program will consist of a Schiumberger Platform Express or Equivalent to be run
from TD to Base of Surface Casing. -

C. No cores are anticipated.

d. Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well Completion and
Recompletion Report and Log" (Form 3160-4) will be submitted not later than 30 days after
completion of the well or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance with
43 CFR 3164. Two copies of all logs, core descriptions, core analyses, well-test data,
geologic summaries, sample description, and all other surveys or data obtained and compiled
during the drilling, workover, and/or completion operations, will be filed with form 3160-4.
Samples (cutting, fluids, and/or gases0 will be submitted when requested by the authorized
officer (AQ).

e. The anticipated completion program is as follows: Perform mulitstage fracs and complete all
productive Mesaverde and Wasatch sands present in wellbore. Produce all zones together.

f. Daily drilling and completion progress reports shall be submitted to the BLM in Vernal on a
weekly basis.

7. ABNORMAL TEMPERATURES OR PRESSURES

a. The expected bottom hole pressure is 7830 psi. The maximum bottom hole temperature
anticipated is 235 degrees F.

b. No hydrogen sulfide gas is anticipated. Abnormal pressures will be controlled with mud
weight and 5000# BOP and rotating head.

W
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ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CONFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal #24-20-10-17 Lease No. UTU-75083
491' FSL and 1789' FWL

SE SW Section 20, T10S - R17E DRILLING PROGRAM
Duchesne County, Utah Page 9
8. ANTICIPATED STARTING DATES AND NOTIFICATION OF OPERATIONS

P

Drilling is planned to commence upon approval of this application.
It is anticipated that the drilling of this well will take approximately 35 days.

The BLM in Vernal, Utah shall be notified of the anticipated date of location construction
commencement and of anticipated spud date.

No location will be constructed or moved, no well will be plugged, and no drilling or workover
equipment will be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without prior
approval of the AO. If operations are to be suspended, prior approval of the AO will be
obtained and notification given before resumption of operations.

The spud date will be reported orally to the AO within 48 hours after spudding. If the
spudding occurs on a weekend or holiday, the report will be submitted on the following regular
work day. The oral report will be followed up with a Sundry Notice.

In accordance with Onshore Qil and Gas Order No. 1, this well will be reported on Form 3160-
6 "Monthly Report of Operations', starting with the month in which operations commence and
continue each month until the well is physically plugged and abandoned. This report will be
filed with the Veral BLM District Office, 170 South 500 East, Vernal, UT 84078.

Immediate Report: Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents, or any other unusual occurrences
shall be promptly reported in accordance with the requirements of NTL-3A or its revision.

If a replacement rig is contemplated for completion operations, a "Sundry Notice" Form 3160-
5 to that effect will be filed, for prior approval of the AO, and all conditions of this approved
plan are applicable during all operations conducted with the replacement rig.

Should the well be successfully completed for production, the AO will be notified when the
wellis placed in a producing status. Such notification will be sent by telegram or other written
communications, not later than 5 days following the date on which the well is placed on
production.

Pursuant to Onshore Order No. 7, with the approval of the District Engineer, produced water
may be temporarily disposed of into unlined pits for a period of up to 90 days. During the
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period so authorized, an application for approval of the permanent disposal method, along
with the required water analysis and other information, must be submitted to the District
Engineer.

k. Pursuant to NTL-4A, lessees or operators are authorized to vent/flare gas during initial well
evaluation tests, not exceeding a period of 30 days or the production of 50 MMCF of gas,
whichever occurs first. An application must be filed with the District Engineer and approval
received, for any venting/flaring of gas beyond the initial 30 day or authorized test period.

A schematic facilities diagram as required by 43 CFR 3162.7-5 (b.9.d.), shall be submitted to
the appropriate District Office within sixty (60) days of installation or first production,
whichever occurs first. Al site security regulations as specified in Onshore Order No. 3 shall
be adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will be
effectively sealed in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-5 (b.4.).

m. A first production conference will be scheduled within 15 days after receipt of the first
production notice.

n. No well abandonment operations will be commenced without the prior approval of the AQ.
In the case of newly drilled dry holes or failures, and in emergency situations, oral approval
will be obtained from the SO. A "Subsequent Report of Abandonment" Form 3160-5, will be
filed with the AO within 30 days following completion of the well for abandonment. This report
will indicate where plugs were placed and the current status of surface restoration. Final
abandonment will not be approved until the surface reclamation work required by the
approved APD or approved abandonment notice has been completed to the satisfaction of
the AO or his representative, or the appropriate Surface Managing Agency.

0. Pursuant to Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, lessees and operators have the responsibility
to see that their exploration, development, production, and construction operations are
conducted in a manner which conforms with applicable Federal laws and regulations and with
State and local laws and regulations to the extent that such State and local laws are
applicable to operations on Federal or Indian lands.

Bureau of Land Management
170 South 500 East
Vernal, Utah 84078
Phone: 435/781-4400 Fax: 435/781-4410
After Hours:

Matt Baker Petroleum Engineer 435/828-4470

Michael Lee Petroleum Engineer 435/828-7875
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90" TEES OR ELLS. ALL LINES SHALL BE AMCIORED.

SURFACE
CASING



ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 LUNFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal #24-20-10-17 Lease No. UTU-75083
491' FSL and 1789' FWL
SE SW Section 20, T10S - R17E SURFACE USE PLAN
Duchesne County, Utah Page 1
ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS
Location Construction - forty-eight (48) hours prior to construction of location and access roads.
Location Completion - prior to moving on the drilling rig.
Spud Notice - at least twenty-four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.
Casing String and - twenty-four (24) hours prior to running casing and
Cementing . cementing all casing strings.
BOP and Related - twenty-four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests.
Equipment Tests
First Production - within five (5) business days after new well begins or
Notice production resumes after well has been off production for more than
ninety (90) days.

The onsite inspection for the subject well site was conducted on October 4, 2005 at approximately 4:10
p.m. Weather conditions were cool, windy and overcast. In attendance at the onsite inspection were the
following individuals:

Karl Wright Natural Resource Specialist Bureau of Land Management

Todd McGraff Wildlife Biologist SWCA

Venessa Langmacher  Permitting Agent Permitco Inc.

Jesse Walton Surveyor Uintah Engineering and Land Surveying
Caleb Rounsaville Field Supervisor Gasco Production Company

1. EXISTING ROADS

a. The proposed well site is located approximately 24.4 miles south of Myton, Utah.

PERMITCO
Noppaxy”
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b. Directions to the location from Myton, Utah are as follows:

Proceed in a southeasterly direction from Myton, Utah for approximately 12.7 miles to the
Castle Peak Mine. Stay right and continue southerly for 6.6 miles to a fork in the road.
Turn right and proceed southwesterly for 1.2 miles until reaching a second fork in the
road. Turn right and proceed southwesterly 2.8 miles. Continue southwesterly on an
existing 2- track for 0.7 miles. Proceed southerly on the proposed access 0.4 miles until
reaching the location.

C. For location of access roads within a 2-Mile radius, see Maps A & B.

d. Improvement to existing main roads will not be required.

e. All existing roads will be maintained and kept in good repair during all drilling and
completion operations associated with this well.

f. Existing roads and newly constructed roads on surface under the jurisdiction of any
Surface Managing Agency shall be maintained in accordance with the standards of the
SMA.

2. PLANNED ACCESS ROADS

a. There will be 0.7 miles of existing 2-track to be upgraded and 0.4 miles of new access.

b. The maximum grade is approximately 3%.

C. No turnouts are planned.

d. No low water crossings or culverts will be necessary.

e. The access road was centerline surveyed at the time of staking.

f. The use of surfacing material is not anticipated, however it may be necessary depending
on weather conditions.

g. No cattle guards will be necessary.
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h. Surface disturbance and vehicular travel will be limited to the approved location and

approved access route. Any additional area needed will be approved in advance.

i. Access roads and surface disturbing activities will conform to standards outlined in the
Bureau of Land Management and Forest Service publication: Surtace Operating
Standards for Oil and Gas Exploration and Development, (1989).

j- The road will be constructed/upgraded to meet the standards of the anticipated traffic flow
and all weather road requirements. Construction/upgrading shall include ditching,
draining, graveling, crowing and capping the roadbed as necessary to provide a well
constructed safe road. Prior to upgrading, the road shall be cleared of any snow cover
and allowed to dry completely. Traveling off the 30 foot right-of-way will not be allowed.
Road drainage crossings shall be of the typical dry creek drainage crossing type.
Crossings shall be designed so they will not cause siltation or accumulation of debris in
the drainage crossing nor shall the drainages be blocked by the roadbed. Erosion of
drainage ditches by runoff water shall be prevented by diverting water off at frequent
intervals by means of cutouts. Upgrading shall not be allowed during muddy conditions.
Should mud holes develop, they shall be filled in and detours around them avoided.

k. No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA Title Il in an amount equal to or greater
than 10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually
in association with the drilling of this well. Furthermore, no extremely hazardous
substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities, will be used,
produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling of this well.

3. LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHIN A 1-MILE RADIUS OF THE PROPOSED LOCATION.

(See Map “C")

a. Water wells - none

b. Injection wells - none
c. Producing wells - one
d. Drilling wells - none
e. Shut-in wells - three

f. Temporarily abandoned wells - none
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o Disposal wells -none

h.

Abandoned wells - two

Dry Holes - none

LOCATION OF TANK BATTERIES AND PRODUCTION FACILITIES.

a.

All permanent structures (onsite for six months or longer) constructed or installed
(including oil well pump jacks) will be painted Carlsbad Canyon. All facilities will be
painted within six months of installation. Facilities required to comply with the
Occupational Safety and Health Act (OSHA) will be excluded.

If storage facilities/tank batteries are constructed on this lease, the facility/battery or the
well pad shall surrounded by a containment dike of sufficient capacity to contain at a
minimum, the entire contents of the largest tank within the facility/battery, uniess more
stringent protective requirements are deemed necessary by the authorized officer.

If production is established, a production facility diagram will be submitted via Sundry
Notice.

All loading lines will be placed inside the berm surrounding the tank battery.

Gas meter runs for each well will be located within 500 feet of the wellhead. The gas flow
line will be buried or anchored down from the wellhead to the separator. Meter runs will
be housed and/or fenced.

The oil and gas measurement facilities will be installed on the well location. The oil and
gas meters will be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. Tests for meter accuracy wil
be conducted monthly for the first three months on new meter installations and at least
quarterly thereafter. The AO will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter
calibration and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports
will be submitted to the Vernal Field Office. All meter measurement facilities will conform
with Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 4 for liquid hydrocarbons and Onshore Qil and Gas
Order No. 5 for natural gas measurement.

W
PERMITCO
N\Coupasy”
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g. If at any time the facilities located on public land and authorized by the terms of the lease

are no longer included in the lease (due to a contraction in the unit or other lease or unit
boundary change), BLM will process a change in authorization to the appropriate statute.
The authorization will be subject to appropriate rental or other financial obligation as
determined by the authorized officer.

h. Any necessary pits will be properly fenced to prevent any wildlife entry.

i All site security guidelines identified in 43 CFR 3162.7 regulations will be adhered to.

j- All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on-lease or off-lease will
have prior written approval from the District Manager.

k. All access roads will be maintained as necessary to prevent erosion and accommodate
year-round traffic.

l. The road will be maintained in a safe useable condition.

m. Produced water will be stored in a 300 bb! heated, insulated tank, then hauled to a
commercial disposal site such as Disposal Inc., or Brennan Bottom.

n. Pipelines will follow the route shown on Map D. See Pipeline detail attached.

5. LOCATION AND TYPE OF WATER SUPPLY

a. The proposed water source will be the Nebecker Water Station in Myton. The Water Use
Claim # is 43-1721.

b. Water will be hauled by Nebecker Water Service to the location over the access roads
shown on Maps A and B.

c. No water well will be drilled on this lease.

6. SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL

a. Surface and subsoil materials in the immediate area will be utilized.
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b. Any gravel used will be obtained from a commercial source.

C. The use of materials under BLM jurisdiction will conform with 43 CFR 3610.2.3.
Construction material will not be located on lease.

d. No construction materials will be removed from Federal land.

7. METHODS OF HANDLING WASTE DISPOSAL

a. The reserve pit will be constructed so as not to leak, break, or allow discharge.

b. At the request of the BLM, the reserve pit will be lined with a 12 mil liner. If fractured rock
is encountered, the pit will be first lined with sufficient bedding (either straw or dirt) to
cover any rocks. The liner will overlap the pit walls and be covered with dirt and/or rocks
to hold it in place. No trash, scrap pipe, etc., that could puncture the liner will be disposed
of in the pit. More stringent protective requirements may be deemed necessary by the
A.O.

C. Burning will not be allowed. All trash will be contained in a trash cage and its contents
removed at the end of drilling operations and hauled to an approved disposal sight.

d. After first production, produced waste water will be confined to a unlined pit or storage
tank for a period not to exceed ninety (90) days. During the 90-day period, in accordance
with Onshore Order No. 7, an application for approval of a permanent disposal method
and location, along with the required water analysis, will be submitted for the AO's
approval. Failure to file an application within the time allowed will be considered an
incident of noncompliance.

e. Drill cuttings are to be contained and buried in the reserve pit.

f. Any salts and/or chemicals which are an integral part of the drilling system will be
disposed of in the same manner as the drilling fluid.

g. A chemical porta-toilet will be furnished with the drilling rig.

h. The produced fluids will be produced into a test tank until such time as construction of

production facilities is completed. Any spills of oil, gas salt water or other produced fluids
will be cleaned up and removed.

PERMITC(
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8. ANCILLARY FACILITIES

There are no airstrips, camps, or other facilities planned during the drilling of the proposed well.

9. WELL SITE LAYOUT

a. The operator or his/her contractor shall contact the BLM Office at 435/781-4400 forty-
eight (48) hours prior to construction activities.

b. A diversion ditch will be constructed along the west side of the pad.
C. The reserve pit will be located on the south side of the location.
d. The flare pit will be located on the west side of the reserve pit, a minimum of 100 feet

from the well head and 30 feet from the reserve pit fence.

e. The stockpiled topsoil (first six inches) will be stored on the northeast side of the location,
between Corners 9 and 2. Topsoil along the access route will be wind rowed on the uphill
side.

f. Access to the well pad will be from the west as shown on the Pit & Pad Layout.

g. See Location Layout for orientation of rig, cross section of drill pad and cuts and fills.

h. The location of mud tanks; reserve pit, trash cage; pipe racks; living facilities and soil

stockpiles will be shown on the Location Layout.
i. All pits will be fenced according to the following minimum standards:

1. 39 inch net wire shall be used with at least one strand or barbed wire on top of
the net wire (barbed wire is not necessary if pipe or some type of reinforcement
rod is attached to the top of the entire fence).

2. The net wire shall be no more than 2-inches above the ground. The barbed wire
shall be 3-inches above the net wire. Total height of the fence shall be at least
42-inches.
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3. Corner posts shall be cemented and/or braced in such a manner to keep the

fence tight at all times.

4. Standard steel, wood, or pipe posts shall be used between the corner braces.
Maximum distance between any two posts shall be no greater than 16 feet.

5. All wire shall be stretched, by using a stretching device, before it is attached to
the corner posts.

The reserve pit fencing will be on three sides during drilling operations and on the fourth
side when the rig moves off the location. Pits will be fenced and maintained until cleanup.

10. PLANS FOR RESTORATION OF SURFACE

Producing Location

a.

Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area will be cleared of all
unused tubing, equipment, debris, materials, trash and junk not required for production.

Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons on the pit shall be removed in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-1.

If a plastic nylon reinforced liner is used it shall be torn and perforated before backfilling of
the reserve pit.

The reserve pit and that portion of the location not needed for production tacilities or
operations will be recontoured to the approximate natural contours. The reserve pit will be
reclaimed within 120 days from the date of well completion. Before any dirt work takes
place, the reserve pit must have all fluids and hydrocarbons removed and all cans,
barrels, pipe, etc., will be removed.

Reclamation of unused disturbed areas on the well pad/access road no longer needed for
operations, such as cut slopes, and fill areas will be accomplished by grading, leveling
and seeding as recommended by the Authorized Officer. The following seed mixture has
been requested by the Bureau of Land Management.
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Species Pounds PLS/Acres
Indian Ricegrass 4
High Crested Wheatgrass 4
Needlegrass 4
Threadgrass 4
TOTAL 12

Seeding will be performed immediately after the location has been reclaimed and the pit
has been backfilled, regardless of the time of year. Seed will be broadcast and walked in
with a dozer.

f. The topsoil stockpile will be seeded as soon as the location has been constructed with the
same recommended seed mix. The seed will be walked in with a cat.

Dry Hole

g. At such time as the well is plugged and abandoned, the operator shall submit a
subsequent report of abandonment and BLM will attach the appropriate surface
rehabilitation conditions of approval.

Interim Surface Reclamation will be as follows:

1. Immediately after final well completion, the location and surrounding area will be cleared
of all unused tubing, materials, trash, and debris not required for production operations.

2. Before any dirt work associated with location restoration takes place, the reserve pit shall
be as dry as possible. All debris in the reserve pit will be removed. Other waste and spoil
materials will be disposed of immediately, weather permitting, upon final well completion.

3. If a synthetic, nylon re-enforced, liner is used, the excess liner will be cut off and removed
and the remaining liner will be torn and perforated while backfilling the reserve pit.
Alternatively, the pit will be pumped dry, the liner folded into the pit, and the pit backfilled.
The liner will be buried to a minimum of four (4) feet deep.
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4, The reserve pit will be rectaimed within 180 days from the date of final well completion,

11.

12.

weather permitting.

The reserve pit and that portion of the location not needed for production and storage
facilities, and everyday production operations, will be reshaped to the approximate original
contours to the extent possible. This will be completed by backfilling and crowning the pit
to prevent water from standing. Topsoil will be re-spread up to the rig anchor points,
excluding the area needed for production and storage facilities and everyday production
operations. Re-seeding, using appropriate reclamation methods, will occur immediately
following the re-spreading of topsoil, weather permitting. The Authorized Officer will
provide a seed mixture to re-vegetate the reserve pit and other unused disturbed areas at
the time of the onsite. B

SURFACE OWNERSHIP

Access Roads - The majority of the access roads are maintained by the County Road Department
or the Bureau of Land Management.

Well pad - The well pad is located on lands managed by the BLM.

OTHER INFORMATION

a.

A Class |ll archeological survey will be conducted by Grand River Institute. A copy of this
will be submitted to the appropriate agencies by Grand River Institute.

The operator is responsible for informing all persons in the areas who are associated with
this project that they will be subject to prosecution for knowingly disturbing historic or
archaeological sites, or for collecting artifacts. If historic or archaeological materials are
uncovered during construction, the operator is to immediately stop work that might further
disturb such materials, and contact the authorized officer (AO). Within five working days
the AO will inform the operator as to:

-whether the materials appear eligible for the National Register of Historic Places;

-the mitigation measures the operator will likely have to undertake before the site can be
used (assuming in situ preservation is not necessary); and
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-a time frame for the AQ to complete and expedited review under 36 CFR 800.11 to
confirm, through the State Historic Preservation Officer, that the findings of the AO are
correct and that mitigation is appropriate. If the operator wishes, at any time, to relocate
activities to avoid the expense of mitigation and/or the delays associated with this
process, the AO will assume responsibility for whatever recordation and stabilization of
the exposed materials may be required. Otherwise, the operator will be responsible for
mitigation costs. The AO will provide technical and procedural guidelines for the conduct
of mitigation. Upon verification from the AQ that required mitigation has been completed,
the operator will then be allowed to resume construction.

C. The operator will control noxious weeds along rights-of-way for roads, pipelines, well sites,
or other applicable facilities. A list of noxious weeds may be obtained from the BLM, or
the appropriate County Extension Office. On BLM administered land it is required that a
Pesticide Use Proposal shall be submitted, and given approval, prior to the application of
herbicides or other pesticides or possible hazardous chemicals.

d. Drilling rigs and/or equipment used during drilling operations on this wellsite will not be
stacked or stored on Federal Lands after the conclusion of drilling operations or at any
other time without BLM authorization. However, if BLM authorization is obtained, it is only
a temporary measure.

e. All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is
made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil and Gas Orders, the approved
plan of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees. The operator is fully
responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be
furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

f. A complete copy of the approved APD shall be on location during construction of the
location and drilling activities.

g. There will be no deviation from the proposed drilling and/or workover program without
prior approval from the AO. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. Al
wells, whether drilling, producing, suspended or abandoned will be identified in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.

h. "Sundry Notice and Report on Wells" (Form 3160-5) will be filed for approval for all
changes of plans and other operations in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.3-2.
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i This permit will be valid for a period of one year from the date of approval. An extension
period may be granted, if requested, prior to the expiration of the original approval period.
After permit termination, a new application will be filed for approval for any future
operations.

j- The operator or his contractor shall contact the BLM Offices at 435/781-4400 48 hours
prior to construction activities.

k. The BLM Office shall be notified upon site completion prior to moving on the drilling rig.

13. LESSEE'S OR OPERATOR'S REPRESENTATIVE AND CERTIFICATION

Permit Matters Drilling & Completion Matters
PERMITCO INC. Gasco Production Company
14421 County Road 10 8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100
Ft. Lupton, CO 80621 Englewood, CO 80112
303/857-9999 (O) John Longwell

303/857-0577 (F) 303/483-0044 (O)

Lisa Smith 303/ 483-0011(F)

Shawn Elworthy
Roosevelt, UT
(Cell) 435-823-4272

CERTIFICATION

| hereby certify that |, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the proposed drill
site and access route; that | am familiar with the conditions which presently exist; that the
statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and correct; and, that the
work associated with the operations proposed herein will be performed by GASCO Energy, Inc.
and its contractors and subcontractors in conformity with the plan and the terms and conditions
under which it is approved.

This statement is subject to the provisions of 18.U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

October 11, 2005 \[;)AW/L %WWMQ/I

Date: Venessa Langmacher PERMITCO INC!
Authorized Agent for:
Gasco Production Company
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16.

PIPELINE INFORMATION

Wilkin Ridge Federal #24-20-10-17
The type of pipeline is a single well flow line.
The outside diameter (O.D.) of all will be 8 inches maximum.
The anticipated production through the line is approximately 2000 MCF per day.
The anticipated maximum test pressure is 1000 psi.
The anticipated operating pressure is 100-200 psi.
The type of pipe is steel.
The method of coupling is welded.
The pipeline will be laid on surface because of the extremely rocky surface.
There are no other pipelines to be associated in same right of way.

There will be other objects to be associated in the same right of way. (Risers, Pig Launchers Pig
Traps, meters and other appurtenances as required.)

The total length of pipeline is approximately 561 feet - see Map D.

The line will be laid on surface as shown on Map D. Where possible, the pipeline will follow existing
or proposed roads.

The construction width for total surface disturbing activities is 30 feet.
The estimated total acreage involving all surface disturbing activities is 0.39 acres.

Any surface disturbance created as a result of the pipeline construction will be reclaimed utilizing the
reclamation procedures and seed mixture specified by the Bureau of Land Management.

The line will be tested with gas pressure to 1000 psi.
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FEDERAL STIPULATIONS

Any wildlife stipulations that pertain to this lease will be attached as a
Conditional of Approval by the Bureau of Land Management.




Archeology

A Class Il Archeological Survey will be conducted by Grand River Institute. A copy of this report will be
submitted directly to the appropriate agencies by Grand River Institute.




Energy $ fj

Bureau of Land Management
Vernal Field Office

170 S. 500 E.

Vernal, UT 84078

Attn: Minerals

Re: Al Wells
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

This letter is to inform you that Permitco Inc. is authorized to act as Agent and to sign
documents on behalf of Gasco Production Company, a wholly owned subsidiary of Gasco
Energy, Inc. when necessary for filing county, state and federal permits including Onshore
Order No. 1, Right of Way applications, etc., for the above mentioned well.

It should be understood that Permitco is acting as Agent only in those matters stated
above and is not responsible for drilling, completion, production or compliance with
regulations.

Gasco Production Company agrees to accept full responsibility for operations conducted in
order to drill, complete and produce the above-mentioned well.

You / ery ty' e
/ /"t 7 "'/'
: / /,4 /4é?b,) ‘{i . ] /,ZM&,/( 2; 2/

Mark J. Choury (/

Land Manager

61800 Energy. Inc,
14 Ipveranss Drive Eest, Suite H-236 Tel: {303) 483-0044 Email:  invest@gascaensrgy.com
Enzle cce, CO BO112-5525 Fax: (303} 483-0011 Website: www.gascoenargy.com 0TCBB GASE



WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: /

-2

e

API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-013-33081

WELL NAME: WILKIN RIDGE 24-20-10-17
OPERATOR : GASCO PRODUCTION ( N2575 ) PHONE NUMBER: 303-857-9999
CONTACT: VENESSA LANGMACHER
PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
SESW 20 1008 170E Tech Review Initials Date
SURFACE: 0491 FSL 1789 FWL
BOTTOM: 0491 FSL 1789 FWL Engineering
COUNTY : DUCHESNE
Geology
LATITUDE: 39.92350 LONGITUDE: -110.0325
UTM SURF EASTINGS: 582682 NORTHINGS: 4419505 Surface
FIELD NAME: EIGHT MILE FLAT ( 95 )
LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal
LEASE NUMBER: UTU-75083 PROPOSED FORMATION: BLKHK
SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal COALBED METHANE WELL? NO
RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:
_ v rplat R649-2-3.
v~ Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Stal] Feel] Unit:. WILKIN RIDGE DEEP Z\K/
(No. UT-1233 )
l( Potash (Y/N) v// R649-3-2. General
D( 0il shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting: 460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells
v~ Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception
(No. 43-1721 ) o '
( ; Drilling Unit
ANl  RDCC Review (Y/N) —
- Board Cause No:
(Date: )
L@ Eff Date:
N Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:
Intent mmingle Y/N . . .
‘JLQ¢' to Co 9 (Y/N) R649-3-11. Directional Drill
COMMENTS :
STIPULATIONS: Lo e ore
} A -

-
Z'kg.'i‘ﬂ(‘in)(l L_Qh ',O




T10S R17E

WRBU 8770
16-19-10-17>

WEST DESERT
SPRING 1-30-10-17

EIGHT MILE FLAT FIELD

WILKIN RIDGE
FED 32:17-10-17

WILKIN RIDGE
FED 34-17-10-17
®

L]
WEST RIVER
BEND 16-17-10-17

20

WEST DESERT
SPRING 11-20:10-17

WILKIN RIDGE
FED 24-20-10-17

e FEDERAL
P 3129 * -

WILKIN RIDGE

JTUNIPER
FEDERAL 1

OPERATOR: GASCO PROD CO (N2575)

SEC: 17,20 T.10S

FIELD: EIGHT MILE FLAT (95)

COUNTY: DUCHESNE

SPACING: R649-3-2 / GENERAL SITING

Field Status
] ABANDONED

[ ACTIVE
COMBINED

[ INACTIVE

[—] PROPOSED
STORAGE
) TERMINATED

Unit Status
EXPLORATORY
GAS STORAGE
NF PP OIL
NF SECONDARY

[ |PENDING

CPioiL
PP GAS
PP GEOTHERML

[ PPOIL
SECONDARY

_) TERMINATED

Wells Status

03-0 O X

TgopoXe

GAS INJECTION

GAS STORAGE
LOCATION ABANDONED
NEW LOCATION
PLUGGED & ABANDONED
PRODUCING GAS
PRODUCING OIL
SHUT-IN GAS

SHUT-IN OIL

TEMP. ABANDONED
TEST WELL

WATER INJECTION
WATER SUPPLY

WATER DISPOSAL
DRILLING

¥ ¥
N
%

Utah Oil Gas and Mining

N

W I

S
PREPARED BY: DIANA WHITNEY
DATE: 06-MARCH-2006




JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
Governor

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah August 14, 2006

Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAEL R. STYLER

Executive Director Gasco Production Company
Division of 8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100
Oil, Gas & Mining Englewood, CO 80112
JOHN R. BAZA
Division birector Re:  Wilkin Ridge Federal 24-20-10-17 Well, 491' FSL, 1789' FWL, SE SW,

Sec. 20, T. 10 South, R. 17 East, Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and

continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-013-33081.

Sincerely,

Gil Hunt ™
&o’\ Associate Director

pab
Enclosures
cc: Duchesne County Assessor

Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 « facsimile (801) 359-3940 « TTY (801) 538-7458 » www.ogm.utah.gov



Operator: Gasco Production Company

Well Name & Number Wilkin Ridge Federal 24-20-10-17

API Number: 43-013-33081

Lease: UTU-75083

Location: SE SW Sec. 20 T. 10 South R. 17 East
Conditions of Approval

1. General

(98]

B

W

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

. Notification Requirements

Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
. Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
. Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

. Reporting Requirements

All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be

obtained prior to drilling.

. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have

not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the “Board”).
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.



Form 3160-3 FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) OMB No. 1004-0136
UNITED STATES R AR Tt Expires November 30, 2000
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 7 77U s Lease Serial No.
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT UTU-75083
6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER N/A
la. Type of Work: m DRILL [l REENTER 7. If Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.
Wilkin Ridge
8. Lease Name and Well No.
b. Type of Well: [_] Oit well  [x] Gas Well ] Other [x] singte Zone  [_] Multiple Zone Wilkin Ridge Federal #24-20-10-17
2. Name of Operator 303-483-0044 8 Inverness Drive East, Suite #100 - AP Well No.
Gasco Production Company Englewood, CO 80112 4’3’ D13 %
3. Name of Agent 303-857-9999 14421 County Road 10 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
Permitco Inc. - Agent Fort Lupton, CO 80621 Wilkin Ridge
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements. *) 11. Sec., T.,R., M., or Blk, and Survey or Area
At surface 491' FSL and 1789' FWL Section 20, T10S-R17E
At proposed prod. zone SE SW
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State
Approximately 24.4 miles south of Myton, UT. Uintel” uushene, UT
T3 Distance from proposed™ 16. No. of Acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit dedicated to this well
location to nearest
property or [ease line, ft. 491"
(Also 10 nearest drig. unit line, if any) 1917.68 40 Acres
T8 Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file
to n]mrde?t vvelltlclinllhggé cf(zmplete.d 1200
applied for, on thisle 13.050'
’ Bond No. UT-1233
21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22. Approximate date work will start* 23. Estimated duration
6105' GL ASAP 35 Days

24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless cove%@ an existing bond on file (see
2. A Drilling Plan. Item 20 above). e (\ ‘CN 0‘
3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, 1 5. Operator certification. [;\G ‘?:3 )N\S\ ‘\r\ “\0@
SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office. 6. Such other site spemﬁc% aﬂa{! s plmnﬁ\?&e required by the
authorized office. Y:)\\ Qg%
CONFIDENTIAL-TIGHT HOLE con BV
Slgnature \ Name (Printed/Typed) A i Date
SAAnCa A4 M l Venessa Langmacher . 10/13/2005
Tme Y v
Authorized Agent for Gasco Production Company _
Approved by (Signature) | Name (Printed/Typed) | Date
Z %',Z : Sy /@:ucz/ﬂq v G-/ 2006
Title I ianages foffice
77 M ral Resources . :

, ewne Freco Drses

Application approval does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to
conduct operations thereon.

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the
United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

JONS OF APPROVAL ATTAGHEEVED
SEP 11 2006

[RIAYAN RIS AT .Y 32 V11 NH Vol

*(Instructions on reverse)




UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
VERNAL FIELD OFFICE
170 South 500 East VERNAL, UT 84078 (435) 781-4400

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company: Gasco Production Company Location: SESW, Sec 20, T10S, R17E
Well No:  Wilkin Ridge Federal 24-20-10-17 Lease No: UTU-75083

API No: 43-047- Agreement:  Wilkin Ridge (Deep) Unit
Petroleum Engineer: Matt Baker Office: 435-781-4490  Cell: 435-828-4470
Petroleum Engineer: Michael Lee Office: 435-781-4432  Cell: 435-828-7875
Supervisory Petroleum Technician:  Jamie Sparger Office: 435-781-4502  Cell: 435-828-3913
Environmental Scientist: Paul Buhler Office: 435-781-4475  Cell: 435-828-4029
Environmental Scientist: Karl Wright Office: 435-781-4484

Natural Resource Specialist: Holly Villa Office: 435-781-4404

Natural Resource Specialist: Melissa Hawk Office: 435-781-4476

Natural Resource Specialist: Chris Carusona Office: 435-781-4441

Natural Resource Specialist: Scott Ackerman Office: 435-781-4437

After Hours Contact Number: 435-781-4513 Fax: 435-781-4410

A COPY OF THESE CONDITIONS SHALL BE FURNISHED TO YOUR
FIELD REPRESENTATIVE TO INSURE COMPLIANCE

All lease and/or unit operations are to be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made with
the applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR Part 3160), and this approved Application for Permit to Drill
including Surface and Downhole Conditions of Approval. The operator is considered fully responsible
for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy of the approved APD must be on location during
construction, drilling, and completion operations. This permit is approved for a one-year period. An
additional year extension may be applied for by sundry notice prior to expiration.

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Location Construction - Forty-Eight (48) hours prior to construction of location
(Notify Karl Wright) and access roads.
Location Completion - Prior to moving on the drilling rig.

(Notify Karl Wright)

Spud Notice - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.

(Notify Petroleum Engineer)

Casing String & Cementing © - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to running casing and
(Notify Jamie Sparger) cementing all casing strings

BOP & Related Equipment Tests - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests
(Notify Jamie Sparger)

First Production Notice - Within Five (5) business days after new well begins or
(Notify Petroleum Engineer) production resumes after well has been off production for

more than ninety (90) days
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Well: Wilkin Ridge Federal 24-20-10-17
7/26/2006

SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

Timing Limitation Stipulation-Sage Grouse Lek Nesting Areas—No surface use is allowed within
the nesting areas during the following time period: March 1 through June 30. This stipulation does not
apply to operation and maintenance of production facilities. This stipulation will not apply if sage
grouse are not present or if impacts shall be mitigated. If it is anticipated that construction or drilling will
be proposed during the timing restriction for sage grouse, a formal exception letter must be sent to the
Authorized Officer at the BLM and a BLM or qualified biologist must be notified prior to the start of
surveys. Depending upon the results of the survey, permission to proceed may or may not be
recommended or granted (depending on the species being surveyed and the condition of the habitat).

Within 90 calendar days of the approval date for this Application for Permit to Drill (APD), the
operator/lessee shall submit to the Authorized Officer (AO), on Sundry Notice Form 3160-5, an Interim
Surface Reclamation Plan for surface disturbance on well pads, access roads, and pipelines. Ata
minimum, this will include the reshaping of the pad to the original contour to the extent possible; the
respreading of the top soil up to the rig anchor points; and, the area reseeded using appropriate
reclamation methods. The AO will provide written approval or concurrence within 30 calendar days of
receipt. The following interim seed mix shall be used:

Type Ibs./acre
Western Wheat grass Agropyron smithii 4
Needle and Thread grass Stipa comata 4
Hy-crest Crested wheat grass Agropyron cristatum 4
** Saed shall be drilled; but if broadcasted double the pounds per
acre used and work the solids mechanically to cover the seed.

if paleontologic materials are uncovered during construction, the operator shall immediately stop work
that might further disturb such materials and contact the Authorized Officer (AO). A determination will
be made by the AO as to what mitigation will be necessary for the discovered paleontologic material.

Following well plugging and abandonment, the location, access roads, pipelines, and other facilities
shall be reclaimed. All disturbed surfaces shall be reshaped to approximate the original contour; the
top soil respread over the surface; and, the surface revegetated. The surface of approved staging
areas where construction activities did not occur may require disking or ripping and reseeding.

Other reclamation methods including but not limited to mulching or soil treatments may be required on
a site-specific basis.

The following seed mixture shall be used to seed the reserve pits and for final abandonment for the
location:

Type Ibs./acre
Hy-crest Crested wheat grass _ Agropyron cristatum 4
Needle and Thread grass Stipa Comata 4
Indian Rice Grass Oryzopsis hymenoides 4
** Seed shall be drilled; but if broadcasted double the pounds per
acre used and work the solids mechanically to cover the seed.

The seed mix may be revised at the time of final abandonment.
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Well: Wilkin Ridge Federal 24-20-10-17
7/26/2006

DOWNHOLE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

All provisions outlined in Onshore Oil & Gas Order #2 Drilling Operations shall be strictly
adhered to. The following items are emphasized:

SITE SPECIFIC DOWNHOLE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

None.

DRILLING/COMPLETION/PRODUCING OPERATING STANDARDS

There shall be no deviation from the proposed drilling, completion, and/or workover program as
approved. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. All wells, whether drilling,
producing, suspended, or abandoned, shall be identified in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.6.
There shall be a sign or marker with the name of the operator, lease serial number, well
number, and surveyed description of the well. Any changes in operation must have prior
approval from the BLM, Vernal Field Office Petroleum Engineers.

The spud date and time shall be reported orally to Vernal Field Office within 24 hours of
spudding.

Notify Vernal Field Office Supervisory Petroleum Engineering Technician at least 24
hours in advance of casing cementing operations and BOPE & casing pressure tests.

Blowout prevention equipment (BOPE) shall remain in use until the well is completed or
abandoned. Closing unit controls shall remain unobstructed and readily accessible at all times.
Choke manifolds shall be located outside of the rig substructure.

All BOPE components shall be inspected daily and those inspections shall be recorded in the
daily drilling report. Components shall be operated and tested as required by Onshore Oil &
Gas Order No. 2 to insure good mechanical working order. All BOPE pressure tests shall be
performed by a test pump with a chart recorder and NOT by the rig pumps. Test shall be
reported in the driller’s log.

BOP drills shall be initially conducted by each drilling crew within 24 hours of drilling out from
under the surface casing and weekly thereafter as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 2.

Casing pressure tests are required before drilling out from under all casing strings set and
cemented in place.

No aggressive/fresh hard-banded drill pipe shall be used within casing.

All shows of fresh water and minerals shall be reported and protected. A sample shall be taken
of any water flows and a water analysis furnished the BLM, Vernal Field Office. All oil and gas
shows shall be adequately tested for commercial possibilities, reported, and protected.

No location shall be constructed or moved, no well shall be plugged, and no drilling or workover
equipment shall be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without prior
approval of the BLM, Vernal Field Office. If operations are to be suspended for more than 30
days, prior approval of the BLM, Vernal Field Office shall be obtained and notification given
before resumption of operations.
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7/26/2006

Chronologic drilling progress reports shall be filed directly with the BLM, Vernal Field Office on a
weekly basis in sundry, letter format or e-mail to the Petroleum Engineers until the well is
completed.

Any change in the program shall be approved by the BLM, Vernal Field Office. "Sundry Notices
and Reports on Wells" (Form BLM 3160-5) shall be filed for all changes of plans and other
operations in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.3-2.

Emergency approval may be obtained orally, but such approval does not waive the written
report requirement. Any additional construction, reconstruction, or alterations of facilities,
including roads, gathering lines, batteries, etc., which will result in the disturbance of new
ground, shall require the filing of a suitable plan pursuant to Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 1 of
43 CFR 3164.1 and prior approval by the BLM, Vernal Field Office.

In accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-3, this well shall be reported on the "Monthly Report of
Operations" (Oil and Gas Operations Report ((OGOR)) starting with the month in which
operations commence and continue each month until the well is physically plugged and
abandoned. This report shall be filed in duplicate, directly with the Minerals Management
Service, P.O. Box 17110, Denver, Colorado 80217-0110, or call 1-800-525-7922 (303) 231-
3650 for reporting information.

Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well Completion and
Recompletion Report and Log" (BLM Form 3160-4) shall be submitted not later than 30 days
after completion of the well or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.4-1. Two copies of all logs run, core descriptions, and all other surveys or
data obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover, and/or completion operations, shall be
filed on BLM Form 3160-4. Submit with the well completion report a geologic report including,
at a minimum, formation tops, and a summary and conclusions. Also include deviation surveys,
sample descriptions, strip logs, core data, drill stem test data, and results of production tests if
performed. Samples (cuttings, fluid, and/or gas) shall be submitted only when requested by the
BLM, Vernal Field Office.

A cement bond log (CBL) will be run from the production casing shoe to the surface casing shoe
and shall be utilized to determine the bond quality for the production casing. Submit a field copy
of the CBL to this office.

Please submit an electronic copy of all other logs run on this well in LAS format to
UT_VN_Welllogs@BLM.gov. This submission will supersede the requirement for
submittal of paper logs to the BLM.

All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on-lease or off-lease shall have
prior written approval from the BLM, Vernal Field Office.

All measurement points shall be identified as point of sales or allocation for royalty
determination prior to the installation of facilities.

Oil and gas meters shall be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. The Field Office
Petroleum Engineers will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter calibration and all
future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports shall be submitted to
the BLM, Vernal Field Office. All measurement facilities will conform to the API standards for
liquid hydrocarbons and the AGA standards for natural gas measurement.
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A schematic facilities diagram as required by Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be submitted
to the BLM, Vernal Field Office within 30 days of installation or first production, whichever
occurs first. All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be
adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will be effectively
sealed in accordance with Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3.

This APD is approved subject to the requirement that, should the well be successfully
completed for production, the BLM, Vernal Field office must be notified when it is placed in a
producing status. Such notification will be by written communication and must be received in
this office by not later than the fifth business day following the date on which the well is placed
on production. The notification shall provide, as a minimum, the following informational items:

Operator name, address, and telephone number.

Well name and number.

Well location (Y44, Sec., Twn, Rng, and P.M.).

Date well was placed in a producing status (date of first production for which

royalty will be paid).

The nature of the well's production, (i.e., crude oil, or crude oil and casing head

gas, or natural gas and entrained liquid hydrocarbons).

o The Federal or Indian lease prefix and number on which the well is located;
otherwise the non-Federal or non-Indian land category, i.e., State or private.

o Unit agreement and / or participating area name and number, if applicable.

o Communitization agreement number, if applicable.

O 0O 0 O

(o]

Any venting or flaring of gas shall be done in accordance with Notice to Lessees (NTL) 4A and
needs prior approval from Field Office Petroleum Engineers.

All undesirable events (fires, accidents, blowouts, spills, discharges) as specified in NTL 3A will
be reported to the BLM, Vernal Field Office. Major events as defined in NTL3A, shall be
reported verbally within 24 hours, followed by a written report within 15 days. "Other than Major
Events" will be reported in writing within 15 days. "Minor Events" will be reported on the
Monthly Report of Operations and Production.

Pursuant to Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 7, this is authorization for pit disposal of water
produced from this well for a period of 90 days from the date of initial production. A permanent
disposal method must be approved by this office and in operation prior to the end of this 90-day
period. In order to meet this deadline, an application for the proposed permanent disposal
method shall be submitted along with any necessary water analyses, as soon as possible, but
no later than 45 days after the date of first production. Any method of disposal which has not
been approved prior to the end of the authorized 90-day period will be considered as an Incident
of Noncompliance and will be grounds for issuing a shut-in order until an acceptable manner for
disposing of said water is provided and approved by this office.

Unless the plugging is to take place immediately upon receipt of oral approval, the Field Office
Petroleum Engineers must be notified at least 24 hours in advance of the plugging of the well, in
order that a representative may witness plugging operations. If a well is suspended or
abandoned, all pits must be fenced immediately until they are backfilled. The "Subsequent
Report of Abandonment" (Form BLM 3160-5) must be submitted within 30 days after the actual
plugging of the well bore, showing location of plugs, amount of cement in each, and amount of
casing left in hole, and the current status of the surface restoration.



OCT 19 2006 8:S6RM HP LASERJET 3200 P-

STATE OF UTAH - FORM 8.
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OiL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM
Operator: _Gasco Production Co Operator Account Number: N 2575
Address: 8 invemess Drive East, Ste 100
city Englewood
state Co zip 80112 Phone Number: _(303) 483-0044
Walt 1
API Number - Woell Neme QQ | Sec | Twp | Rng County
4301333081 Wilkin Ridge Federal 24-20-10-17 SESW] 20 10 17 Duchesne
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
: Number Number _ Effective Date
L » 199999 /5714 e | /0/,9/0¢
Comments: — X
el BLICRL =V D CONFIDENTIAL
Wel 2
API Number Wall Name QQ | Sec | Twp | Rng County
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Dats Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date
Comments
Wek 3
APl Number Well Name - QR | Sec | Twp | Rng |  Counly
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date
Comments:
ACTION CODES:

A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only)
B - Add new well fo existing sntity (group or unit well)

C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity LLoa_
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity
E - Other (Explain in ‘comments’ saction) Engineering Technician 10/19/2006
Date
RECEIVED
(6/2000)
OCT 19 2006

DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING



Energy

Div
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining OF OIL, GAS & M/N/NG
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Attn: Carol Daniels
October 18, 2006

Dear Ms Daniels:

Gasco Production Company will soon be drilling the Wilkin Ridge Federal 24-20-10-17,
SESW 20-10S-17E, Duchesne County, Utah. The API Number for this well is 43-013-
33081.

Gasco wishes to keep all information on this well CONFIDENTIAL for as long a period
as possible.

Yours truly,

Robin Dean

Geological Manager
Gasco Energy, Inc.

GASCO Energy, Inc.
8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100 Tel: (303) 483-0044 Email: invest@gascoenergy.com

Englewood, CO 80112-5625 Fax: {303) 483-0011 Website: www.gascoenergy.com AMEX: GSX



Form 3160- § UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

{April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004- 0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007
S. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-75083
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.
. Type of Well . NA
Do.l Weli Gas Welt DOlher A Vi g f 8. Well Name and No.
2. Name of Operator SRR Wilkin Ridge Federal 24-20-10-17
Gasco Production Company 9. APl Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-013-33081
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R, M., or Survey Description) Eight Mile Flat
49| FSL & 1789' FWL SE SW 11. County or Parish, State
T/ 05 R]TE s Duchesne County, Utah
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT. OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

DNolice of Intent DAcidizc DDeepen DProduction ( Start/ Resume) I:IWaIer Shut-off
DAhering Casing DFraclure Treat Dkeclamalion DWC“ Integrity
Subsequem Report DC asing Repair DNew Construction DRecomplele Other

DC hange Plans I:IPlug and abandon DTemporan'ly Abandon
DFinal Abandonment Notice I:]Conven to Injection DPlug back DWater Disposal

13. Descnbe Proposed or Completed Operations {clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete honzontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

10/18/2006: MIRU Bill Martin Jr rig and drilled 240" of 17-1/2" hole. Set 220’ of 13 3/8"
conductor pipe. Cemented same with 275 sx of class G cement. Returned 8 bbls of cement to

surface.
oc" 2 3 2““5
NG
o i\S &N\\N\
o, OF 088
4. 1 hereby certify that the foregoing is true and corect.
Name (Printed Typed)
Titl

Beverly Walker ‘ Engineering Technician

Si Date
“ 7 5/ e é«// A October 20, 2006
THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or|
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease]Office
which  would entitle  the applicant to  conduct __operations _thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudul OF repr ions as to any matter within its jurisdiction,

{Instructions on page 2)



Vg UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

I N
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expres N 313007
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 3 Lease Seral No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-75083
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. I Indian. Allotiee or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement. Name and/or No.
WILKIN RIDGE

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side.

I. Type ofﬁll .
Ol Well Gas Well D Other 8. Well Name and Na
WILKIN RIDGE FEDERAL 24-20-10-17
2 Name of Operator
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY S APTWailNo.
3a  Address 3b. Phone No. (inchute area code) 43-013-33081
8 INVERNESS DR. E, # 100, ENGLEWOOD, CO 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool. or Exploratory Area

WILKIN RIDGE
i1. County or Parish. State

4. Location of Well (Footage. Sec.. T., R. M., or Survey Description)
SE SW of Section 20-T10S-R17E 491'FSL X 1789'FWL

DUCHESNE, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
I:I Acidize D Deepen D Production (StarResume) D Water Shul-Off
Notice of Intent D Aller Casing D Fracture Treat D Reclamation D Well Integrity
DSuhseqnenl Report D Casing Repair D New Construction D Recomplete ()ﬂm Increase Proposed
Change Plans ] Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon Depth, Revise Casing
D Final Abandonment Notios D Convert to Injection D Plug Back D Water Disposal & Cement Program

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete honizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Altach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval. a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
tesling has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only afler all requirements. including reclamation. have been completed. and the operator has
determined that the sile is ready for final inspection.)

1. Revise proposed total depth to 13,250 (Blackhawk). )
2. Production casing program depth revised (0 13,250' of 4-1/2", 13.54/f1., P-110 L, T&C (new). L ‘
o ! SR IO CRERATOT:

i
3. Production casing cement program revised to 523 SX Hi-Lift @ 11.5 PPG, yicld = 3.05 cuftSX; followed by 1?44 SX AW Poz !
PP, yield = 1.28 cuft/SX. the PSSon >
Approved by [ —-
Utah Division of o
| of this Oil, Gas and Mining RECEIVI ™

va -
postorst PPE cassoy D OCT 2 4 2006

ACMO“ Date- ‘O" - A 3
'X\l)&i s R S] DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING
By: o

14. Thereby centify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

ANTHONY W. SHARP > Title SENIOR ENGINEER

Signature }7 Date 10/182006

HIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approvedby Title Date
Conditions of approval. if any. are attached. Approval of this nolice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office

which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 USC. Section 1001 and Title 43 U S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as 1o any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)



GASCO

GASCO ENERGY

7 /05 R)VE 3’2& |

E DAILY DRILLING REPORT Y3-0/3~3=> o3/
nergy AFE # 40144 GPS
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 |Per.depth: 13,050 |Prog. depth: 13,000 |Date: 10/00/2006 Days since spud:  RU1
Current: Operations: MOVE AND RIG UP NABORS 270
IDepth: IProg: |D Hrs: IAV ROP: #DIV/0! IFormatIon:
lomc: $0 |TMC: $0 TDC: $20,350 |cwc: $57,742
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-| Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Mw: |#1 IBit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
ViS: ISPM: Size: JSurf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: I#2 Type: Ilnt. Csg: $ -  |Day Rate: $ 17,500
Gel: SPM: IMFG: IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 500
WL: GPM : SIN: [Froat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: JPress: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuen $ -
Sand: AV DP: ‘Depth In: JPackers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -
|PH : JetVel: IFTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
PfIMF: JECD: IHrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: SPR#1 : IFPH: JHeater: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca : SPR#2 : WOB: IPumpIng ur:  $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
{Dapp ppb: iBtm.Up: |R-RPM: IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: |Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 850
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: IDain Total: $ - |orilling Mud: $ -
06:00 MOVE FROM WRS 44-32 AND RIG UP Misc. / Labor: $ 1,500
0 Csg. Crew: $ -
0 Daily Total: $ 20,350
0 Cum. Wir: $ -
0 Cum. Fuel $ -
0 Cum. Bits: $ -
0 BHA
0
0
0
0
0
0
0 RECEIVED
2 ET-3-0-2006-
0
0 ng OF QL GAS &MlN[NG TOTAL BHA = 0.00
0 Survey
24.00 Survey
P/U K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/0 K# FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3534 GL PEAK GAS
JFUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man  Scott Alired TRIP GAS




GASCO
Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

T I0S K[IE S0
Y 3-013~ 333 |

AFE # 40144 GPS
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17  |Per.depth: 13,050 |Prog. depth: 13,161 11/1/2006 Days since spud: RUS
Current: Operations: PICK UP BHA
Depth: 3540’ IProE ID Hrs: IAV ROP: #DIV/Q! IFormatlon: UINTA
DMC: $0 |T™C: $0 TDC: $50,867 |cwc: $169,659
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

Imaw: |#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm IBIt #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: SPM: Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
|pvive: l#2Pz9 3.6 gpm Type: FM3555Z fint. Csg: $ -  |DayRate: $ 17,500
lGel: SPM: |vFa: SEC IProd Csg: $ - |Rentat Tools: $ 500
WL: GPM : SIN: 10674143 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: JPress: Jets: 5X22 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ 21,017
Sand: AV DP: IDepth In: 3540 JPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ -
PH : JetVel: lFTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
PHME: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: SPR#1 : IFPH: JHeater: $ - |sits: $ 9,500
Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: IPumping ur: 3 - |Mud Motors: 3 -
IDapp ppb: |Btm.up: ~_|r-RPM: IPrIme Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [M-RPM: IMIsc: $ - [consutant: $ 850
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: IDain Total: $ - |orilling Mud: $ -
06:00 16:00 10:00 JRIG UP FLOOR Misc. / Labor: $ 1,500
16.00 22:00 6:00 JRU Quick Test - Test Blind Rams, Pipe Rams,Upper & Lower Kelly, Ing. Crew: $ -
22:00 Floor Valves, Kill Line & Choke Line Valve, Choke Manifold & Valves Daily Total: $ 50,867

0 ALL To 5000psi High & 250psi Low - Test AnuilarBOP To 2500psi Cum. Wtr: $ -

0 Test Casing To 1500psi - All OK PUT ONE BAD VALVE ON MANAFOLD Cum. Fuel $ 21,017
22:00 23:00 1:00 [RIG UP LAY DOWN CREW AND SAFETY MEETING Cum. Bits: $ 9,500
23.00 06:00 7:00 JPICK UP BHA BHA

lsir wpogy 77/8 1.83
MM .29 6259 38.84
NEW VALVE ON LOCATION WILL CHANGE QUT AND TEST IBS 5.56
AFTER BHA IS IN THE HOLE 1-DC 6% 28.64
1BS 5.42
5-DC's 149.08
26 WHDP 798.68
WASATCH 5101 1561" RECEIVED p»ar 31.34
MESAVERDE 9296 5756' R 9- WHDP 276.41
CASTELGATE 11946 8406' Wﬁﬁ& TOTAL BHA = 1335.80]
SUNNYSIDE 12441 8901 i e Al ARG O MANMA  [SUTVey
24.00 |TD 13161 9621' DIV, VU, SRS T Survey
PV K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/0 Ki# FLARE: GAS BUSTEF OFF CONN GAS
ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3540 PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS




GASCO
Energy

GASCO ENERGY

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

T/60S RIVE Swzp

- 0[3— 330
G%ga@%?/

AFE # 40144
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 __ |Per.depth: 13,050 [Prog. depth: 13,161 11/2/2006 Days since spud: 1
Current: Operations: DRLG
Depth: 4340’ |Prog: 800 |pHrs:  101/2|avRoP: 76.2 |Formation: UINTA
lomc: $4,780 [rmc: $4,780 TDC: $36,355 Jewe: $164,347
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 805 |#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm |Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 25 SPM: 75 ISize: 77/8 Jsurt. csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
[pvive: 11 [2pz9 3.69pm Type: FM3555Z Ilnt. Csg: $ -  |pay Rate: $ 22,000
Gel: 11/1  |spPm: 75 IMFG: SEC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 500
fwL: GPM : 550 Ism: 10674143 Float Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: JPress: 2150 Jets: 5X22 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 1 AV DC: 57 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet: $ -
Sand: AV DP: 44 |Depth In: 3540 JPackers: $ - |Mudiogger: $ -
|PH : 9.5 JetVel: IFTG: 800 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ 800
PfIMf: ECD: 8.5 IHrs: 10 1/2 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 2000 |spr#1: [epu: 76.2 JHeator: $ - |sits: $ -
Ca : 260 SPR #2 : WOB: 25 IPumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,050
IDapp ppb: iBtm.Up: JR-RPM: 50 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 160 IMlsc: $ - Consultant: $ 850
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: 10.5 IDaIIy Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $4,780
06:00 07:30 1:30 JCONT. PICKING UP 3500' OF BHA AND PIPE Misc. / Labor: $ 1,500
07:30 08:00 0:30 |RD LAY DOWN CREW Ing. Crew: $ 4,875
08:00 11:00 3:00 |LEVEL DERRICK AND CHANG OUT MANIFOLD VALVE IDaily Total: $ 36,355
11:00 12:00 1:00 JRETEST MANIFOLD AND MUD LINES ALL GOOD ICum. Wir: $ 4,044
12:00 19:00 7:00 |DRLG OUT CEMENT ICum. Fuel $ 21,017
19:00 19:30 0:30 [SURVEY @ 3540' 2'%° lcum. Bits: $ 9,500
19:30 06:00 10:30 |DRLG 3540' TO 4340" (800' @ 76.2 FPH) BHA
Jer wpbocy 77/8 1.83
MM .29 6259 38.84
IBS 77/8 5.56
1-DC 6% 28.64
SPUD ON 11/1/2006 @ 19:30 hrs IBS 77/8 5.42
J5-DC's 6% 149.08
26 WHDP 42 798.68
WASATCH 5101 761" RFCF’I\IFD JH-E JARS 6% 31.34
MESAVERDE 9296 4956' 9- WHDP 4% 276.41
CASTELGATE 11946 7606' NOVUZ 2006  |roraLBHA- 1335.80
SUNNYSIDE 12441 8101 o [Survey  [2%° 3540'
24.00 |D 13161 8821" DV OF O GAS S MINING 5 ey
iPIU 115 Ki# LITH: 80 % SH, 20 % SS. BKG GAS 12
S/I0 105 K# FLARE: GAS BUSTEF OFF CONN GAS 37
ROT. 110 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3540 PEAK GAS 86
FUEL Used: 589 On Hand: 10200 Co.Man Scott Allred TRIP GAS




GASCOENERGY __ . . . .,
DAILY DRILLING REPORT 9,3,05__3308[

GASCO

Energy

AFE # 40144

GPS N. 39°55'24.5" W110°02'02.8"

Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 |Per.depth: 13,050 [Prog. depth: 13,161 11/3/2006 |Days since spud: 2
Current: Operations: DRLG
Ipepth:  5410' [Prog: 1070 |pHrs: __ 231/2_ [avRoP: 45.5 _|rormation: WASATCH
DMC: $4,109 lTMc: $8,889 TDC: $36,984 |cwe: $591,245
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drig. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 8.5 |#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm IBit #: 1 Conductor: $ - {Loc,Cost: $ -
Vis: 25 ISPM: 75 ISlze: 778 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
IPviYP: 1/1 |;2 PZ-9 3.6 gpm Type: FM35552 lint. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 22,000
Gel: 1/1/1  |spm: 75 |vre: SEC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 500
WL: GPM : 550 ISIN: 10674143 lFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
iCake: |Press: 2400 Jets: 5X22 IWeII Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 1 AV DC: 420 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet $ -
1Sand: AV DP: 337 [Depth in: 3540 Packers: $ - Mud Log_ggr: $ -
IPH : 10.0 JetVel: 96 IFI’ G: 1870 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ 800
I:ﬂMf: 3.7/5.4 [eco: 8.7 IHrs: 34 |Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
IChIor: 2000 |spr#1: 40@200 [Fen: 55.0 IHeater: $ - [sits: $ -
l;a : 140 SPR#2: 40@175 WOB: 25 lPumpIng ur:  $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,350
IDapp ppb: |Btm.Up: 14 ~_ JR-RPM: 50 lPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 160 IMIsc: $ - Consuitant: $ 850
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: 34.0 IDain Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $4,109
06:00 9:30 3:30 |DRLG 4340' TO 4516' (176' @ 50.2 FPH ) Misc. / Labor: $ 1,500
9:30 10:00 0:30 |SURVEY @ 4516 1%4° Csg. Crew: $ 4,875
10:00 06:00 20:00 |DRLG 4516' TO 5410' (894' @ 44.7 FPH ) |Daily Total: $ 36,984
ICum. Witr: $ 4,044
Cum. Fuel $ 21,017
jCum. Bits: $ 9.500
BHA
BIT w/DoG{ 77/8 1.83
MM .29 6259 38.84
IBS 77/8 5.56
1-DC 6% 28.64
IBS 77/8 5.42
ls-ocs 6% 149.08
26 WHDP 4% 798.68
WASATCH 5101 o' JH-E JARS 6%2 31.34
MESAVERDE 9296 3886’ 9- WHDP 4% 276.41
CASTELGATE 11946 6536 TOTAL BHA = 1335.80
SUNNYSIDE 12441 7031 Survey 2Y2° 3540
24.00 |TD 13161 7751 Survey [1%4° 4516'
P/U 145 K# LITH: 90 % SH, 10 % SS. BKG GAS 12
S/0 135 K# FLARE: NONE GAS BUSTEF  OFF CONN GAS 37
ROT. 142 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3540 PEAK GAS 86
FUEL Used: 1696 On Hand: 71395 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS




GASCO
Energy

GASCO ENERGY

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
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AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'24.5" W110°02'02.8"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 |Per.depth: 13,050 |Prog. depth: 13,161 11/4/2006 |Days since spud: 3
Current: Operations: DRLG
[Depth: 6365’ [prog: 955 |pHrs: 3 |av RoP: 318.3 _|Formation: WASATCH
lomc: $10,860  |TMC: $19,749 TDC: $41,685 Jewc: $632,930
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drig. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
mw- 8.5 [MpPz9 3.6gpm fic #: 1 2 Conductor: $ - |ioccost: $ -
VIS: 25 SPM: 75 Size: 77/8 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
|pvive: 11 |#2pPz9 3.6 gpm Type: FM3555Z 5062 Jint. Csg: $ - |payRate: $ 22,000
Gel: 1/1/1  |spm: 75 JMFG: SEC HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 500
WL: GPM : 550 ISIN: 10674143 711069 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: JPress: 2400 Jets: 5X22 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Sollds: 1 AV DC: 420 TD Out: 5506 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ -
Jsand: AV DP: 337 Depth in: 3540 5506 JPackers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -
IPH H 10.0 JetVel: 96 IFTG: 2825 759 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ 800
IPfIMf: 2.5/8.5 [ecp: 8.7 IHrs: 37 13 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
IChIor: 2000 JsPrR#1: 40@200 IFPH: 76.4 58.3 [Heater: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca : 100 Jspr#2: 40@175 IWOB: 25 IPumping ur: $ - Mud Motors: $ 300
IDapp ppb: 5.1 Btm.Up: 17 IR-RPM: 50 IPrIme Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |m-rewm: 160 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 850
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: 37.0 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $10,860
06:00 09:00 3:00 |IDRLG 5410' TO 5506' ( 96' @ 32 FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ 1,500
09:00 9:30 0:30 JCIRC. 10 MIN. DROP SURVEY @ 5506 2° Csg. Crew: $ 4,875
9:30 12:30 3:00 |TOOH FOR BIT #2 Daily Total: $ 41,685
12:30 14:00 1:30 JCHANGE OUT BIT AND MOTOR ICum. Wir: $ 4,044
14:00 17:00 3:00 |JTIH [Cum. Fuel $ 21,017
17:00 06:00 13:00 |DRLG 5606' TO 6365 (759" @ 58.3 FPH) Cum. Bits: $ 9,500
BHA
lsr 77/8 1.83
MM .29 2092 32.97
. IBS 77/8 5.56
Rl:bthED 1-DC 6% 28.64
No_v_o_sm IBS 77/8 5.42
' 5.0C's 6% 149.08
DIV_OF OIL, GAS & MiNiNe 26 WHDP | 4% 798.68
WASATCH 5101 o o |heuars | % 31.34
MESAVERDE 9296 2931 |9- WHDP 4% 276.41
CASTELGATE 11946 5581' TOTAL BHA = 1329.93
SUNNYSIDE 12441 6076' Survey 1%° 4516’
24.00 |TD 13161 6796' Survey 2° 5506'
P/U 145 K# LITH: 75 % SH, 25 % SS. BKG GAS 8
S/0 135 K# FLARE: NONE GAS BUSTEF OFF CONN GAS 10
ROT. 142 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3540 PEAK GAS 16
JFUEL Used: 1696 On Hand: 71395 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS
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AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'24.5" W110°02'02.8"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 |Per.depth: 13,050 |Prog. depth: 13,161 11/5/2006 IDays since spud: 4
Current: Operations: DRLG
Depth: _ 7490' |Prog: 1125 |DHrs: 23 |avROP: 48.9 |Formation: WASATCH
lomc: $1,022 [rmc: $21,671 TDC: $35,747 |cwc: $681,177
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
IMw: 8.5 I#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm lBit #: 2 Jconductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 25 SPM: 113 ISIze: 77/8 ISurf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
Ipvive: 1/1  |#2pz-9 3.6gpm Type: 5062 Ilnt. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 22,000
Gel: 1/1/1  [sPm: JVMFG: HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,500
WL: GPM : 416 SIN: 711069 IFloat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
ECake: JPress: 1292 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Isotids: 1 AV DC: 316 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fue $ -
Sand: AV DP: 212 |pepthin: 5506 |Packers: $ - |MudLogger: $ -
IPH : 9.5 JetVel: 113 IFTG: 1979 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ 800
lele: 2./9 Jecp: 8.6 IHrs: 36 Jseparator: $ - |cement: $ -
IChlor: 2000 sPR#1: 40@200 IFPH: 55.0 lHeater: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca : 100 IsPrR#2: 40@175 WOB: IPumpIng ur:  $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,300
|Dapp ppb: 55 IBtm.Up: 29 JR-RPM: 50 IPrIme Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 53 IMlsc: $ - |[consultant: $ 850
START END TIME % Total Rot. Hrs: 60.0 lDaIIy Total: $ - iDrilling Mud: $1,922
06:00 08:30 2:30 |IDRLG 6365' TO 6551' ( 186' @ 74.4 FPH ) w/ two pumps Misc. / Labor: $ 1,500
08:30 09:00 0:30 {SURVEY @ 6488 2° |ng. Crow: $ 4,875
09:00 02:30 17:30 |DRLG 6551 TO 7349' (798 @ 45.6 FPH ) w/ one pump Daily Total: $ 35,747
02:30 03:00 0:30 |HOOK UP KELLY SPINNER ( ST-80 OUT OF SERVICE) JCum. Wir: $ 4,044
03:00 06:00 3:00 |DRLG 7349 TO 7485 (136' @ 45.3 FPH) ICum. Fuel $ 21,017
Jcum. Bis: $ 19,000
BHA
e 77/8 1.83
IMm 20 | 2092 32.07
IBS 77/8 5.56
RECEIVED 1-DC 6% 28.64
I'ss 77/8 5.42
NBV‘H‘?OOG 5-DC's 6% 149.08
DU OF GH-GAS--hite— (20000 | % | 796,08
WASATCH 5101 o' H-E JARS 6%2 31.34
MESAVERDE 9296 1806' 9- WHDP 4% 276.41
CASTELGATE 11946 4456' TOTAL BHA = 1329.93
SUNNYSIDE 12441 4951’ Survey 1%4° 4516’
24.00 |TD 13161 5671' Survey 2° 5506'
P/U 175 K# LITH: 80 % SH, 220 % SS. BKG GAS 8
S/0 160 K# FLARE: NONE GAS BUSTEF OFF CONN GAS 10
ROT. 170 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3540 PEAK GAS 16
FUEL Used: 1202 On Hand: 4914 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS
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AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 _ |Per.depth: 13,050 |Prog. depth: 13,1 61 11/6/2006 |Days since spud: 5
Current: Operations: DRLG
[Depth: 8196 |Prog: 706 ID Hrs: 23 IAV ROP: 30.7 lFormation: WASATCH
lomc: $885 lTmc: $22,556 TDC: $34,710 |owe: $715,887
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
IMw: 8.5 |#1 PZ9 3.6gpm IBit #: 2 IConductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
vIS: 25 SPM: 70 Size: 77/8 ISurf. Csg: $ - |RigMove: $ -
levivp: 1/1  W2pPZ9 3.6gpm Type: 5062 Ilnt. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 22,000
Gel: 11/1  |sPm: 70 IvFG: HTC |Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,500
WL: . GPM : 416 ISIN: 711069 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: IPress: 2250 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 1 AV DC: 397 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuen $ -
ISand: AV DP: 267 JDepth In: 5506 JPackers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -
IPH : 9.5 JetVal: 142 |FTG: 2690 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ 800
IPfle: 1.8/8.7 [eco: 8.6 |Hrs: 59 Separator: $ - |cement: $ -
Chior: 2000 ISPR #1:  40@200 Jepn: 45.6 |Heator: $ - |IBits: $ -
Ca : 100 ISPR #2: 40@175 WOB: 25/30 IPumping LIT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2,300
IDapp ppb: 5.4 IBtm.Up: 26 |r-RPM: 50 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 53 IMlsc: $ - |Consultant: $ 850
START END TIME Y Total Rot. Hrs: 83.0 IDaily Total: $ - |orilling Mud: $885
06:00 08:00 2:00 |DRLG 7485' TO 7574' (89' @ 44.5FPH) IMIsc.I Labor: $ 1,500
08:00 08:30 0:30 |SURVEY @ 7509 2° Ing. Crew: $ 4,875
08:30 16:30 8:00 |DRLG 7574' TO 7892' (318' @ 39.7 FPH) Daily Total: $ 34,710
16:30 17:00 0:30 [RIG SERVICE Cum. Wtr: $ 4,044
17:00 06:00 13:00 |DRLG 7892' TO 8196' (304' @ 23.3 FPH ) Cum. Fuel $ 21,017
Cum. Bits: $ 19,000
BHA
IsiT 77/8 1.83
MM .13 2092 32.97
1BS 77/8 5.56
1-DC 6% 28.64
MUD UP AT 8,000' RFCFIVED IBS 77/8 5.42
. 5-DC's 6% 149.08
Nw_m 26 WHDP 4% 798.68
MESAVERDE 9296 1100’ s el maad LA H-E JARS 6% 31.34
CASTELGATE 11946 3750 O O S N o whoe | s 276.41
GRASSY 12196 4000 TOTAL BHA = 1329.93
SUNNYSIDE 12441 4245 Survey 2° 6488'
24.00 |TD 13161 4965' Survey 2° 7509’
P/U 185 K# LITH: 70 % SH, 30 % SS. BKG GAS 5
S/0 175 K# FLARE: NONE GAS BUSTEF OFF CONN GAS 5
ROT. 180 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3540 PEAK GAS 10
FUEL Used: 1660 On Hand: 3254 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS
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AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 _|Per.depth: 13,050 |Prog. depth: 13,161 11/7/2006 |Days since spud: 6
Current: Operations: DRLG
Depth: 8515’ |Prog: 319 |pHrs: 14 |avRoP: 22.8 _|Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $31,603 |TMC: $54,159 TDC: $64,528 |cwc: $801,832
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 lMud Co: M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
IMW: 8.9 I#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm IBn #: 2 3 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 41 SPM: 70 Size: 77/8 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
JPVIY P: 11/16 2pz-9 3.6 gpm Type: 506Z 506ZX Jint. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 22,000
Gel: 10/23/36 |SPM: 70 MFG: HTC HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,500
WL: 9.2 GPM : 416 ISIN: 711069 7111060 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
lcake: Press: 2250 Jets: 6X16 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 3 AV DC: 397 TD Out: 8275 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuen $ -
Sand: AV DP: 267 JDepth In: 5506 8275 jPackers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -
Ipn 95  |etver 142 |rre: 2769 240 |ranks: $ - |Logging: $ 800
IPfIMf: 1/7.8 [eco: 9.36 IHrs: 63 10 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 2000 ISPR #1: 50@400 IFPH: 44.0 24.0 [Heater: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca : 100 |spr#z:  40@300 |woe: 25/30 25/30 [pumping:  $ - |Mud Motors: $ 1,400
|bapp ppb: 5.5 IBtm.Up: 28 IR-RPM: 50 50 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 53 53 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 850
START END TIME Y% Total Rot. Hrs: 97.0 IDalIy Total: $ - |orilling Mud: $31,603
06.00 10:00 4:00 |DRLG 8196’ TO 8275 (79'@ 19.7 FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ 1,500
10:00 10:30 0:30 JPUMP PILL AND DROP SURVEY @ 8179 2° Csg. Crew: $ 4,875
10:30 14:00 3:30 |TOOH FOR BIT Daily Total: $ 64,528
14.:00 15:30 1:30 |JCHANGE OUT BIT AND MOTOR Cum. Wir: $ 4,044
15:30 19:30 4:00 |TIH JCum. Fuel $ 42,434
19:30 20:00 0:30 JREAM 90' TO BOTTOM ( NO FILL) loum. Bits: $ 19,000
20:00 06:00 10:00 |DRLG 8275' TO 8515' (240'@ 24 FPH) BHA
BIT 77/8 1.83
MM .13 2061 32.98
IBS 77/8 5.56
1-DC 6% 28.64
IBS 77/8 5.42
5-DC's 6% 149.08
26 WHDP 4 798.68
MESAVERDE 9296 781 RECEIVED JH-E JARS 6% 31.34
CASTELGATE 11946 3431" bl o wHDP | 4% 276.41
GRASSY 12196 3681 NOVU7Z2006  lrovaLeHa= 1329.94
SUNNYSIDE 12441 3926 .. [Survey 2° 7509'
24.00 Io 13161 4646' DI U UIL, BAS & MINIINQG Survey 20 8179"
P/U 185 K# LITH: 85 % SH, 15 % SS. BKG GAS 0
S/0 175 K# FLARE: NONE GASBUSTEF OFF CONN GAS 0
ROT. 180 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3540 PEAK GAS 16
FUEL Used: 1644 On Hand: 9802 Co.Man  Scott Alired TRIP GAS
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AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17  |Per.depth: 13,050 |Prog. depth: 13,161 11/8/2006 |Days since spud: 7
Current: Operations: DRLG
|Depth: 8914’ IProg: 399 ID Hrs: 231/2 IAV ROP: 17.0 IFonnation: WASATCH
IDMC: $3,706 ITMC: $57,865 TDC: $37,581 |cwC: $848,477
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 9.1 I#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm IBIt #: 3 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
viIS: 45 SPM: 70 ISize: 7718 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
|pvive: 13/19 [#2pz9 3.6 gpm Type: 5062X Jint. csg: $ - |payRate: $ 22,000
Gel: 14/35/50 |spm: 70 |vFa: HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,500
WL: 8.4 GPM : 516 SIN: 7111060 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: JPress: 2376 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 6 AV DC: 392 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuenr $ -
Sand: AV DP: 263 JDepth In: 8275 JPackers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -
IPH : 9.5 JetVel: 141 IFTG: 639 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ 800
IPfIMf: 1/7.8 |eco: 9.36 IHrs: 33.5 Separator: $ - Cement: 3 -
Chlor: 2000 ISPR #: 50@400 IFPH: 19.1 Heater: $ - Bits: 3 -
Ca : 120 ISPR #2: 40@300 IWOB: 25/30 IPumping ur:  $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,350
IDapp ppb: 5.4 IBtm.Up: 30 IR-RPM: 50 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 53 IMisc: $ - Consultant: $ 850
START END TIME Y Total Rot. Hrs: 120.5 IDaIIy Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $3,706
06:00 1600 10:00 JDRLG 8515' TO 8689' (174 @ 17.4 FPH ) IMIsc.ILabor: $ 1,500
16:00 16:30 0:30 JRIG SERVICE Ing. Crew: $ 4,875
16:30 06:00 13:30 |DRLG 8689' TO 8914' (225' @ 16.6 FPH ) IDain Total: $ 37,581
ICum. Wir: $ 13,108
ICum. Fuel $ 42,434
Cum. Bits: $ 19,000
REGENED BHA
jaiT 77/8 1.83
NOV 0 8 2006 Ium 13 | 2061 32.98
IBS 77/8 5.56
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING 1-DC 6% 28.64
I'BS 77/8 5.42
5-DC's 6% 149.08
26 WHDP 4% 798.68
MESAVERDE 9296 382' JH-E JARS 6%2 31.34
CASTELGATE 11946 3032 9- WHDP 4% 276.41
GRASSY 12196 3282 TOTAL BHA = 1329.94
SUNNYSIDE 12441 3527 Survey 2° 7509'
24.00 |TD 13161 4247 Survey 2° 8179
P/U 185 K# LITH: 30 % SH, 70 % SS. BKG GAS 6
S/O 175 K# FLARE: NONE GAS BUSTEF  OFF CONN GAS 0
ROT. 180 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3540 PEAK GAS 14
FUEL Used: 1644 On Hand: 9802 Co.Man Scott Allred TRIP GAS
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AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 _ [Per.depth: 13,050 |Prog. depth: 13,161 11/9/2006 Days since spud: 8
Current: Operations: DRLG
Depth: 9290' |Prog: 376 |D Hrs: 24 IAV ROP: 156.7 IFormatIon: WASATCH
DMC: $2,592 [rme: $60,457 TDC: $36,517 |cwe: $884,994
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 9.3 lmeze 3s gpm [it#: 3 {conductor: $ - Jroccost: 3 -
VIS: 39 SPM: 68 Size: 77/8 ISurf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: -
fpvive: 12/16 _l#2P29 3.6 gpm Type: 506ZX Ilnt. Csg: $ -  |Day Rate: $ 22,000
IGel: 10/25/40 ISPM: 68 JMFG: HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,500
IWL: 8.4 |GPM : 501 Ism: 7111060 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Iane: 4.4 IPress: 2479 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 6 AV DC: 381 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Isand: AV DP: 255 JDepth In: 8275 packers: $ - IMud Logger: $ -
I;H : 9.0 JetVel: 136 IFTG: 1015 Tanks: $ - Inglng: $ 800
IPfIMf: .7/6.8 |eco: 9.7 IHn: 57 1/2 ]Separator: $ - |cement: $ -
IChIor: 2000 Ispn #: 50@400 IFPH: 17.7 lHeater: $ - |Bits: $ -
F:a : 120 |sPr#2: 40@300  |wos: 25/30 IPumping ur: % - |Mud Motors: $ 2,400
IDapp ppb: 5.1 |etm.up: 32 |r-rPM: 50 IPrlme Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [M-RPM: 53 IMIsc: $ - |consuitant: $ 850
START END TIME % Total Rot. Hrs: 144.5 |Dally Total: $ - |orilling Mud: $2,592
06:00 06:00 24 |DRLG 8914' TO 9290' (376'@ 15.7 FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ 1,500
Csg. Crew: $ 4,875
Daily Total: $ 36,517
lcum. war: $ 13,108
ICum. Fuel $ 42,434
fcum. Bits: $ 19,000
BHA
Isit 77/8 1.83
MM .13 2061 32.98
IBS 77/8 5.56
1-DC 6% 28.64
IBS 77/8 542
§s-DC's 6% 149.08
26 WHDP 4% 798.68
MESAVERDE 9296 6 lhesars | 6% 31.34
CASTELGATE _ 11946 2656 fo- whor | 4% 276.41
GRASSY 12196 2906 TOTAL BHA = 1329.94
SUNNYSIDE 12441 3151 Survey 2 7509’
24.00 |TD 13161 3871 Survey 2 8179
ipu 205 K# LITH: 20 % SH, 80 % SS. BKG GAS 6
S/0 187 K# FLARE: NONE GAS BUSTEF OFF CONN GAS 0
ROT. 195 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3540 PEAK GAS 14
FUEL Used: 1815 On Hand: 6204 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS
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AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01°02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17__ {Per.depth: 13,050 [Prog. depth: 13,161 11/10/2006 IDays since spud: 9
Current: Operations: CUT AND SLIP DRLG LINE
|Depth: 9451’ |Prog: 161 ID Hrs: 14 IAV ROP: 11.5 lFormatIon: MESAVERDE
DMC: $629 [TMC: $61,086 TDC: $50,803 Jowe: $901,672
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 [Mud co: M-I Drig. Fiuids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
IMw: 9.4 I#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm IBIt #: 3 4 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 38 |sem: 68 Isize: 77/8 77/8  Jsur.Csg: $ - [Rigmove: $ -
levive: 11/13 |#2 PZ9 3.6 gpm Type: 506ZX 506ZX Ilnt. Csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 22,000
foer: 9/21/36 |spm: 68 |mFa: HTC HTC  |prod cse: $ - [RentalTools: $ 1,500
wi: 8.2 JopPMm: 501 SIN: 7111060 7112845 IFIoat Equp: $ - |rrucking: $ -
Cake: Press: 2479 Jots: 6X16 6X16 IWoll Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 4.2 AV DC: 381 TD Out: 9451 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ 22,124
ISand: AV DP: 255 Depth In: 8275 9451 Packers: $ - IMud Logger: $ -
IPH : 9.0 JetVel: 136 IFTG: 1176 [Tanks: $ - lLogging: $ 800
h’fle: .5/6.9 [eco: 9.7 IHrs: 71 1/2 {Separator: $ - |cement: $ -
IChlor: 1000 ISPR #1: 50@400 IFPH: 16.4 Ineater: $ - |Bits: $ -
ICa : 100 ISPR #2: 40@300 IWOB: 25/30 IPumplng ur:  $ - lMud Motors: $ 1,400
lDapp ppb: 4.8 IBtm.Up: 34 IR-RPM: 50 IPrImc Mover: $ - Corrosion; $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 53 IMisc: $ - |consuttant: $ 850
START END TIME 1 Total Rot. Hrs: 158.5 IDaily Total: $ -~ |Drilling Mud: $629
06:00 13:00 7:00 JDRLG 9290' TO 9390' (100'@ 14.2FPH) IMisc.lLabor: $ 1,500
13:00 13:30 0:30 JWORK ON # 2 PUMP TRACTION MOTOR Ing. Crew: $ -
13:30 20:30 7:00 |DRLG 9390' TO 9451' (61 @ 8.7 FPH ) IDaily Total: $ 50,803
20:30 21.00 0:30 JPUMP PILL AND DROP SURVEY @9451 2%:° ICum.Wtr: $ 13,108
21:00 01:30 4:.30 JTOOHFORBIT#4 ICum. Fuel $ 64,558
01:30 03:00 1:30 JCHANGE OUT BIT AND MOTOR ICum. Bits: $ 19,000
03:00 05:00 2:00 |JTIHIN TO SHOE 3520' BHA
05:00 06:00 1:00 JCUT AND SLIP DRLG LINE lsir 77/8 1.83
IMm.13 [ 2075 35.44
IBS 77/8 5.56
1-DC 6% 28.64
liss 77/8 5.42
e Is-oc's 6% 149.08
RECEIVED 26 WHDP | 4% 798.68
MESAVERDE 9296 -155' NoVP EAZIVED liesars | 6 31.34
CASTELGATE 11946 2495' _NOV_1-3-2005 bo-whop | 276.41
GRASSY 12196 2745 TOTAL BHA = 1332.40
SUNNYSIDE 12441 2990 DIV. OF Ol GAS & MiNIngSurvey 2° 8179'
24.00 |TD 13161 3710 Isurvey 2°
P/U 205 K# LITH: 25 % SH, 75 % SS. BKG GAS 7
S/0 187 K# FLARE: NONE GAS BUSTEF OFF CONN GAS
ROT. 195 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3540 PEAK GAS 33
FUEL Used: 1815 On Hand: 6204 Co.Man  Scott Alired TRIP GAS
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gy AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 _ [Per.depth: 13,050 |Prog. depth: 13,161 11/11/2006 Days since spud: 10
Current: Operations: DRLG
Depth: 10000’ |Prog: 549 ID Hrs: 19 IAV ROP: 28.9 |Formaﬁon: MESAVERDE
DMC: $2,465 lmc: $63,551 TDC: $31,015 Jewe: $932,687
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drig. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 9.5 I#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm IBit #: 4 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 45 SPM: 115 Isize: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 17/18 [#2Pz9 3.6 gpm Type: 506ZX Jint. Csg: $ - |payRate: $ 22,000
Gel: 10/26/36 [sPm: DOWN |vFe: HTC IProd Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,500
WL: 8 GPM : 419 SIN: 7112845 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: JPress: 225 Jots: 6X16 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 4.6 AV DC: 381 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuei: $ -
Sand: AV DP: 255 fDepth In: 9451 JPackers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -
iPH : 9.0 JetVel: 136 IFTG: 549 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ 800
IPfle: .5/5.5 JECD: 9.7 IHrs: 19 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 1000 ISPR #1: 50@500 IFPH: 28.9 [Heater: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca : 100 SPR#2 : wWOB: 25/30 IPumping LT $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,900
|Dapp ppb: 4.4 |Btm.Up: 41 R-RPM: 50 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 53 IMlsc: $ - Consultant: $ 850
START END TIME 1 Total Rot. Hrs: 177.5 IDain Total: $ - |Dritling Mud: $2,465
06:00 07:30 1:30 JCONT. CUT AND SLIP DRLG LINE Misc. / Labor: $ 1,500
07:30 09:30 2:00 JTIH Csg. Crew: 3 -
09:30 10:30 1:00 JREAM TO BOTTOM 90' ( NO FiLL) Daily Total: $ 31,015
10:30 17:00 6:30 |DRLG 9451’ TO 9649' (198'@ 30.4 FPH) fcum. wir: $ 13,108
17:00 17:30 0:30 JRIG SERVICE ICum. Fuel $ 64,558
17:30 06:00 12:30 |[DRLG 9649 ' TO 10000' (351'@ 28.0 FPH) lcum. Bits: $ 19,000
BHA
| G118 77/8 1.83
Ium.13 | 2075 35.44
IBS 778 5.56
1-DC 6% 28.64
# 2 PUMP IS DOWN ({ TRACTION MOTOR ) fss 778 5.42
ls-0c's 6% 149.08
RECEIVED leewhor | 4% 798.68
|H-E JARS 6% 31.34
CASTELGATE 11946 1946' W_ZUUB 9- WHDP 4% 276.41
GRASSY 12196 2196 Y OAE AL s s TOTAL BHA = 1332.40
SUNNYSIDE 12441 2441" - T R ENINING sy rvey 2° 8179
24.00 |TD 13161 3161 Survey 2°
P/U 210 K# LITH: 60 % SH, 40 % SS. BKG GAS 12
S/0 205 K# FLARE: NONE GAS BUSTEF OFF CONN GAS 59
ROT. 208 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3540 PEAK GAS 667
FUEL Used: 1369 On Hand: 11589 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS




GASCO GASCO ENERGY ISR IV 536
‘Eﬁ—é}—— DAILY DRILLING REPORT Yy 3~0/3~ 3308
gy AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 _ [Per.depth: 13,050 [Prog. depth: 13,161 11/12/2006 |Days since spud: 11
Current: Operations: DRLG
Depth: 10383 |Prog: 383 |pHrs: 23 |avROP: 16.7__|Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $2,881 lTMe: $66,432 TDC: $31,831 |ewec: $964,518
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drlg. Fiuids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW 9.8 I#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm IBlt #: 4 Conductor: $ Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 48 SPM: 115 Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ Rig Move: $ -
lpvive: 20/20 J#2pz-9 3.6 gpm Type: 506ZX Jint. csg: $ Day Rate: $ 22,000
loe: 14/30/46 |spm: 0 JvFc: HTC |Prod Csg: $ Rental Tools: $ 1,500
WL: 8 GPM : 419 SIN: 7112845 IFIoat Equp: $ Trucking: $ -
Cake: |Press: 225 Jots: 6X16 Well Head: $ Water: $ -
Solids: 6 AV DC: 381 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ Fuel: $ -
Sand: AV DP: 255 [Depth in: 9451 |Packers: $ Mud Logger: $ -
IPH : 9.0 JetVel: 136 IFTG: 932 Tanks: $ Logging: $ 800
IPfIMf: .4/6 [ecp: 9.7 IHrs: 42 Separator: $ Cement: $ -
Chlor: 1000 |sPr#1: 50@500 IFPH: 22.2 [Heater: $ Bits: $ -
Ca : 100 SPR #2 : IWOB: 25/30 IPumping L/T: $ Mud Motors: $ 2,300
[Dapp ppb: 4.9 JBtm.up: 41 IR-RPM: 50 IPrime Mover: $ Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 53 IMisc: $ Consultant: $ 850
START END TIME 1% Total Rot. Hrs: IDain Total: $ Drilling Mud: $2,881
06:00 12:30 6:30 |IDRLG 10000 ' TO 10140' (140'@ 21.5FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ 1,500
12:30 13:00 0:30 |RIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: $ -
13:00 13:30 0:30 JWORK ON #1 PUMP Daily Total: $ 31,831
13:30 06:00 16:30 |JDRLG 10140 ' TO 10385' (245'@ 14.8 FPH) Cum. Wir: $ 13,108
fCum. Fuel $ 64.558
Cum. Bits: $ 19,000
BHA
IsiT 77/8 1.83
IMm.13 | 2075 35.44
1BS 77/8 5.56
1-DC 6% 28.64
IBS 778 5.42
}Js-DC's 6% 149.08
RECEIVED 26 WHDP | 4% 798.68
T T heumrs | ex 31.34
CASTELGATE 11946 1563' NOV 13 2006 lo-whop | 276.41
GRASSY 12196 1813’ TOTAL BHA = 1332.40
SUNNYSIDE 12441 2058' DIV UFUIL, GAS & NINE™ gy rvey 2° 8179
24.00 |TD 13161 2778 Survey 2%° 9451’
P/U 218 K# LITH: 25 % SH, 75 % SS, 2% SLTST. BKG GAS 14
S/O 208 K# FLARE: NONE GAS BUSTEF OFF CONN GAS 68
ROT. 213 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@_ 3540 PEAK GAS 119
FUEL Used: 1433 On Hand: 101565 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS




GASCO
Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

T/0S R IE S=e
. 3—-013- 33061

AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17  [Per.depth: 13,050 |Prog. depth: 13,161 11/14/2006 |Days since spud: 13
Current: Operations: DRLG
Depth: 10785 IProg: 295 |D Hrs: 23 IAV ROP: 12.8 IFormation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $1,619 ITMC: $71,328 TDC: $30,569 jcwc: $1,106,128
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 lMud Co: M-| Drig. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 9.8 |#1 PZ9 3.6 gpm IBit #: 5 Conductor: $ - |Loc,cost: $ -
VIS: 49 ISPM: 115 Isize: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 20/28 [#2 PZ-9 3.6 gpm Type: MKS66DRG ilnt. Csg: $ - |pay Rate: $ 22,000
Gel: 14/34/45 ISPM: 0 IMFG: VERAL IProd Csg: $ - IRentaI Tools: $ 1 ,500
WL 7.8 GPM : 424 SIN: 2818 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
lcake: 1/ IPress: 2500 Jets: 6X18 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
|so||ds: 15 AV DC: 322 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
rSand: TR AV DP: 216 Joepth In: 10446 JPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ -
PH : 9.0 JetVel: 91 IFTG: 339 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ 800
mf: 2./5.8 iECD: 10.4 |Hrs: 245 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chior: 1000 ISPR #: 50@500 IFPH: 13.8 {Heater: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca : 100 ISPR #2: WOB: 25/30 IPumpmg ur:  $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2,300
Dapp ppb: 4.9 |Btm.Up: 45 R-RPM: 50/53 IPrIme Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: TotalD.T. [M-RPM: 53 IMIsc: $ - |cConsuttant: $ 850
START END TIME 5 | Total Rot. Hrs: 232.5 IDain Total: $ - JDrilllng Mud: $1,619
06:00 17:00 11:00 |DRLG 10490' TO 10637' (147'@ 13.3FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ 1,500
17:00 17:30 0:30 |RIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: $ -
17:30 04:00 10:30 [DRLG 10637' TO 10775' (138'@ 13.1 FPH) Daily Total: $ 30,569
04:00 04:30 0:30 JWORK ON PUMPS Cum. Wir: $ 13,108
04:30 06:00 1:30 {DRLG 10775' TO 10785' (10'@6.6 FPH) JCum. Fuel $ 64,558
Jcum. Bits: $ 28,500
BHA
ler 778 1.83
[um.a3 | 2015 35.41
— IBS 77/8 5.56
L 1-DC 6% 28.64
NOV 1 4 2006 |iBS 77/8 5.42
5-DC's 6% 149.08
DIV. OF QlL, GAS & NINING 26 WHDP | 4% 798.68
[H-E JARS 6% 31.34
CASTELGATE 11946 1161’ 9- WHDP 4% 276.41
GRASSY 12196 1411° TOTAL BHA = 1332.37
SUNNYSIDE 12441 1656' Survey 2'4° 9451
24.00 |tD 13161 2376' Survey 2% | 10446
P/U 230 K# LITH: 40 % SH, 60 % SS, 0% SLTST. BKG GAS 230
S$/0 210 K# FLARE: NONE GAS BUSTEF OFF CONN GAS 2298
ROT. 218 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3540 PEAK GAS 6775
FUEL Used: 1606 On Hand: 7529 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS




GASCO
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GASCO ENERGY L

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
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AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 |Per.depth: 13,050 Prog;depth: 13,161 11/15/2006 |Days since spud: 14
Current: Operations: DRLG
Depth: 10875' lmg: 90 |D Hrs: 11 |AV ROP: 8.2 |Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $3,639 |TMC: $74,967 TDC: $47,900 |cwe: $1,158,118
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-1 Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Mw: 10 I#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm IBit #: 5 6 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 50 SPM: 115 Size: 77/8 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 19/30 J2pz9 3.6gpm Type: MKS66DRG | FMH37532R [int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 22,000
Gel: 15/35/45 [spm: 0 IMFG: VERAL SEC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,500
fwe: 7.8 |ePm: 424 Ismv: 2818 10878722 IFIoat Equp: $ - |vrucking: $ -
ICake: 1/ |Press: 2500 Jots: 6X18 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 7,011
[Solids: 13 AV DC: 322 TD Out: 10863 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet: $ -
Sand: TR AV DP: 216 |Depth In: 10446 10863 JPackers: $ - jMud Logger: $ -
|PH : 9.0 JetVel: 91 IFTG: 417 Tanks: $ - Log__g_lng: $ 800
PfIMf: .2/6 JECD: 10.4 IHrs: 34 1/2 |Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 1000 _Jser#1:  50@500 |rem: 12.1 [Heater: $ - lens: $ 9,500
ca : 100 |spr#2: WoB: 25/30 lpumpingir:  § - IMud Motors: $ 1,100
jDapp ppb: 5 |Btm.Up: 47 |R-RPM: 50/53 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 53 IMlsc: $ - Consultant: $ 850
START END TIME 5 Total Rot. Hrs: 243.5 IDain Total: $ - |Driling Mud: $ 3,639
06:00 16:00 10:00 |DRLG 10785' TO 10863’ (78'@ 7.8 FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ 1,500
16:00 21:00 5:00 JDROP SURVEY AND TOOH FOR BIT  2%° Ing. Crew: $ -
21:00 22:30 1:30 |CHANGE OUT BIT AND MOTOR |Daily Total: $ 47,900
22:30 | 01:30 3:00 |TIH Cum. Wir: $ 20,119
01:30 02:00 0:30 |FILL PIPE @6100' Jcum. Fuel $ 64,558
02:00 04:30 2:30 |TIH lcum. Bits: $ 38,000
04:30 05:00 0:30 JWASH AND REAM 90' TO BOTTOM ( NO FILL) BHA
05:00 06:00 1:00 |DRLG 10863' TO 10875 (12'@ 12FPH) | =10 77/8 1.83
IMm.a3 | 2127 33.00
1BS 77/8 5.56
1-DC 6% 28.64
IBS 77/8 5.42
5-DC's 6% 149.08
PR 26 WHDP | 4% 798.68
REb:‘ T H-E JARS 6% 31.34
CASTELGATE 11946 1071' Ng)‘j o} 2005 9- WHDP 4% 276.41
GRASSY 12196 1321' . HOTAL BHA = 1329.96
SUNNYSIDE 12441 1566’ e Ol GRS O VTS ey | 2%e | g4st’
24.00 |0 13161 2286' T survey | 2v° | 10446
ey 230 K# LITH: 35% SH, 65 % SS, 0% SLTST. BKG GAS 500
S/0 210 K# FLARE: NONE GAS BUSTEF YES  CONN GAS 2267
ROT. 218 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3540 PEAK GAS 2267
FUEL Used: 1606 On Hand: 7529 Co.Man  Scott Alired TRIP GAS




GASCO
Energy

GASCO ENERGY s 4 75 5-26

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
AFE # 40144

GPS N. 39°55'26.5"

4 3-0/3- 3308 |

W110°01'02.59.6"

Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 {Per.depth: 13,050 |Prog. depth: 13,161 11/16/2006 lDays since spud: 15
Current: Operations: TRIPPING
IDepth:  11116' [Prog: 241 |DHrs: 15 |av roPp: 161 |Formation:  LOWER MESAVERDE
DMC: $7,271 [rmc: $82,238 TDC: $44,921 |cwe: $1,203,039
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-| Drig. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Mw: 10 I#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm IBit #: 6 7 Conductor: $ Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 46 SPM: 110 Size: 77/8 778 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
Ipvivp: 17/23 J#2Pz-9 3.6 gpm Type: FMH37532R MI913 Jint. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 22,000
Gel: 14/32/42 |spm: 0 |vra: SEC STC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,500
JWL: 8.6 GPM : 405 ISIN: 10878722 SX0075 lFIoat Equp: $ Trucking: $ -
lCake: 1/ |Press: 2400 Jots: 6X16 9X14 IWell Head: $ Water: $ -
Solids: 11.5 Javoc: 308 TD Out: 11116 TBG/Rods: $ Fuel: 3 -
{Sand: TR AV DP: 206 Depth In: 10863 11116  [packers: $ Mud Logger: $ -
lPH : 9.0 JetVel: 110 IFTG: 253 Tanks: $ Logging: $ 800
IPfIMf: .2/6 |eco: 10.5 IHrs: 16 Separator: $ Cement: $ -
Chlor: 1000 |JsPrR#1: 50@500 epn: 12.0 |Heater: $ Bits: $ 9,500
Ca : 100 |sPr#2: WOB: 25/30 IPumpIng ut: $ Mud Motors: $ 1,500
|Dapp ppb: 5 |Btm.Up: 50 JR-RPM: 50/53 IPrIme Mover: $ Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |m-RPM: 53 IMisc: $ Consultant: $ 850
START END TIME 5 Total Rot. Hrs: 258.5 IDaily Total: $ Drilling Mud: $ 7,271
06:00 21:00 15:00 |DRLG 10875' TO 11116' (241'@ 16.0 FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ 1,500
21:00 21:30 0:30 JPUMP PILL Ing. Crow: $ -
21:30 02:30 5:00 JTOOH FOR BIT #7 IDain Total: $ 44,921
02:30 03:00 0:30 |CHANGE OUT BIT FCum. Witr: $ 20,119
03:00 06:00 3:00 JTIH Cum. Fuel $ 64,558
Cum. Bits: $ 47,500
BHA
| 1L 77/8 1.83
Mm.13 | 2127 33.00
CorivCEm IBS 77/8 5.56
et i 1-DC 6% 28.64
NOV 1 6 2006 IBS 77/8 5.42
5-DC's 6% 149.08
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING 26 WHDP | 4% 798.68
|H-EvARs | 6% 31.34
CASTELGATE 11946 830’ |9- WHDP 4% 276.41
GRASSY 12196 1080’ TOTAL BHA = 1329.96
SUNNYSIDE 12441 1325' Survey 214° 10446'
24.00 |TD 13161 2045' Survey 2%° 10863’
P/U 230 K# LITH: 25% SH, 75% SS, 0% SLTST. BKG GAS 1200
S/0 210 K# FLARE: NONE GAS BUSTEF NO CONN GAS 2665
ROT. 218 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3540 PEAK GAS 4826
JFUEL Used: 1606 On Hand: 7529 Co.Man Scott Allred TRIP GAS
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AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 _ |Per.depth: 13,050 |Prog. depth: 13,161 11/17/2006 IDays since spud: 16
Current: Operations: TRIPPING
Depth: __11270' |Prog: 154  [p Hrs: 16 |av ROP: 9.6  |Formation:  LOWER MESAVERDE
DMC: $2,402 |TMC: $84,640 TDC: $40,152 Jcwc: $1,243,191
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
IMw: 10 |#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm IBIt #: 7 8 [Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 45 ISPM: 113 Size: 77/8 77/8 ISurf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
|PVIYP: 17/20 I#2 PZ-9 3.6 gpm Type: MI913 5092 Ilnt. Csg: $ - {Day Rate: $ 22,000
Gel: 15/35/43 fspm: 0 IMFG: STC HTC IProd Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1 ,500
(WL: 7.8 GPM : 416 S/N: SX0075 IFloat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
[Cake: 1/ JPress: 2400 Jets: 9X14 IWeII Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 11 AV DC: 316 TD Out: 11270 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet $ -
ImeT: 16.25 Javpp: 212 Depth in: 11116 11270  |Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ -
IPH : 9.0 JetVel: 113 IFTG: 154 Tanks: $ - JLogging: $ 800
IPfle: .2/6 ECD: 10.5 IHrs: 16 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 1000 [sPR#t: 50@500 IFPH: 9.6 [Heater: $ - |Bits: $ 9,500
Ca : 100 SPR#2 : \WOB: 25/30 IPumpIng L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,600
IDapp ppb: 5 |Btm.Up: 50 JR-RPM: 50/53 IPrIme Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: TotalD.T. |M-RPM: 53 IMisc: $ - |consuttant: $ 850
START END TIME 5 Total Rot. Hrs: 274.5 IDaIIy Total: $ - |orilling Mud: $ 2,402
06:00 06:30 0:30 |FILL PIPE @5600 Misc. / Labor: $ 1,500
06:30 | 08:30 | 2:00 |TH fosg. crow: $ -
08:30 09:00 0:30 |FILL PIPE AND WASH TO BOTTOM ( NO FILL) IDain Total: $ 40,152
09:00 11:00 2:00 |[DRLG 11116' TO 11143' (27' @ 13.5'FPH ) ICum. Wir: $ 20,119
11:00 11:30 0:30 |RIG SERVICE Cum. Fuel $ 64,558
11:30 02:00 14:30 |DRLG 11143 TO 11270" (127’ @ 14.5'FPH ) Cum. Bits: $ 57,000
02:00 02:30 0:30 JPUMP PILL BHA
02:30 06:00 3:30 JTOOH FORBIT jBiT 77/8 1.83
Ium .13 [ 2127 33.00
IBS 77/8 5.56
1-DC 6% 28.64
RECEIVED  [Jes 778 5.42
NQH_HBGD 5-DC's 6% 149.08
) v 26 WHDP | 4% 798.68
DIV OF Oll_GAS & MINING JH-E JARS 6% 31.34
CASTELGATE 11946 676 9- WHDP 4% 276.41
GRASSY 12196 926' TOTAL BHA = 1329.96
SUNNYSIDE 12441 1171 Survey 2%° 10446’
24.00 |TD 13161 1891' Survey 2%° 10863’
P/U 240 K# LITH: 60 % SH, 40 % SS, 0% SLTST. BKG GAS 1500
S/0 215 K# FLARE: 10' AFTER TRIP GAS BUSTEF NO CONN GAS 2345
iROT. 227 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3540 PEAK GAS 6738
FUEL  Used: On Hand: Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS
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GASCO GASCO ENERGY T
T /05 RI2E 5-20
Energy DAILY DRILLING REPORT Y2013~ 330%]
AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 _ |Per.depth: 13,050 [Prog. depth: 13,161 11/18/2006 Days since spud: 17
Current: Operations: DRLG
Depth: __ 11478' [Prog: 208  [p Hrs: 14 lav rOP: 14.9  |Formation:  LOWER MESAVERDE
fomc: $1,920 lTmC: $86,560 TDC: $39,470 Jewc: $1,305,194
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
IMw: 10.1 I#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm IBIt #: 7 8 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 47 SPM: 113 Size: 77/8 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PV/YP: 17/21 |#2pPZ-9 3.6 gpm Type: MI913 509Z Jint. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 22,000
Gel: 15/35/43 |spm: 0 |vrFe: STC HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,500
WL 7.8 GPM : 416 SIN: SX0075 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/ fPress: 2400 Jets: 9X14 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 11 AV DC: 316 TD Out: 11270 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuen $ -
IMBT: 13.75 JavDe: 212 [Depth In: 11116 11270  JPackers: $ - [Mud Logger: $ -
H H 9.0 JetVel: 113 IFTG: 154 206 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ 800
PIMf: .2/6.3 Jeco: 10.6 IHrs: 16 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chilor: 1000 [sPR#1: 50@500 IFPH: 9.6 #DIV/0! Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,500
Ca : 100 SPR#2: WOB: 25/30 Pumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,400
|Dapp ppb: 5.1 |Btm.Up: 50 JR-RPM: 50/53 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 53 IMIsc: $ - |consultant: $ 850
START END TIME 5 Total Rot. Hrs: 288.5 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 1,920
06:00 07:30 1:30 JCONT. TOOH Misc. / Labor: $ 1,500
07:30 08:30 1:00 JCHANGE OUT BIT AND MOTOR Csg. Crew: $ -
08:30 10:00 1:30 [TIH TO SHOE Daily Total: $ 39,470
10:00 12:00 2:00 JCUT AND SLIP DRLG LINE iCum. wir: $ 20,119
12:00 13:00 1:00 |JTIH ICum. Fuel $ 87,091
13:00 13:30 0:30 JFILL PIPE @ 5650 lcum. Bus: $ 66,500
13:30 15:00 1:30 |TIH BHA
15:00 15:30 0:30 JWASH AND REAM 90' TO BOTTOM ( NO FILL) |k 77/8 1.83
15:30 24:00 8:30 |DRLG 11270' TO 11429 (159' @ 18.7 FPH) IMM 13 2086 32.83
24:00 00:30 0:30 JRIG SERVICE IBS 77/8 5.56
00:30 06:00 5:30 |DRLG 11429' TO 11478 (49' @ 8.9 FPH) 1-DC 6%s 28.64
IBS 77/8 5.42
5-DC's 6% 149.08
26 WHDP 4% 798.68
RECEIVED |neuars | 6% 31.34
CASTELGATE 11946 468’ 9- WHDP 4% 276.41
GRASSY 12196 718 Nmﬁm TOTAL BHA = 1329.79
SUNNYSIDE 12441 963' e Ao 0 AN [SUrvey 2Y5° 10446’
24.00 |10 13161 1683' U e S  survey | 24 | 10863
P/U 240 Ki# LITH: 60 % SH, 40 % SS, 0% SLTST. BKG GAS 2000
S/0 215 K# FLARE: 15 AFTER TRIP GAS BUSTEF YES CONN GAS 5972
ROT. 227 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3540 PEAK GAS 5972
IFUEL Used: 1229 On Hand: 10112 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS 3682
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nergy AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17  [Per.depth: 13,050 [Prog. depth: 13,161 11/19/2006 |Days since spud: 18
Current: Operations: CONDITION MUD FOR PARTICLE DRLG
Depth: 11525’ lProg: 47 |D Hrs: 9 |AV ROP: 5.2 IFonnation: LOWER MESAVERDE
DMC: $0 fTmMe: $86,560 TDC: $37,050 |ewec: $1,342,244
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 10 I#1 PZ-9 3.6gpm lBit #: 8 9 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 44 SPM: 113 Size: 77/8 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
fpvive: 17/19 |#2pPz-9 3.6 gpm Type: 509Z 12B Jint. Csg: $ -  |Day Rate: $ 22,000
Gel: 12/33/41 [spm: 0 MFG: HTC PDT IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,500
WL: 7.8 GPM : 416 SIN: 7113200 60290 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/ JPress: 2400 Jets: 6x16 4X9.5 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 10.5 Javbc: 316 TD Out: 11525 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fue: $ -
IMBT: 13.12 JAvDP: 212 |Depth In: 11270 11525 JPackers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -
IPH : 9.0 JetVel: 113 IFTG: 255 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ 800
[PfIMf: .2/6.6 [eco: 10.6 IHrs: 23 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 1000 |sPR#1: 50@500 IFPH: 11.1 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,500
iCa : 100 SPR #2 : IWOB: 25/30 Pumping LIT:  $ - Mud Motors: $ 900
IDapp ppb: 5.1 Btm.Up: 50 IR-RPM: 50/53 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. lM-RPM: 53 lMisc: $ - Consultant: $ 850
START END TIME 5 Total Rot. Hrs: 297.5 IDaIIy Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ -
06:00 15:00 9:00 [DRLG 11478 TO 11525' (47" @ 5.2FPH) IMlsc.ILabor: $ 1,500
15:00 19:30 4:30 JPUMP PILL, DROP SURVEY AND TOOH FOR PARTICLE DRLG. |ng. Crew: $ -
19:30 20:30 1:00 JLAY DOWN MOTOR,IBS, CHANGE OUT BIT Daily Total: $ 37,050
20:30 23:00 2:30 [INSTALL CHECK VALVEW IN MUD LINE Cum. Wir: $ 20,119
23:00 05:30 6:30 |TIH FILL PIPE @ 6458 Cum. Fuel $ 87,091
05:30 06:00 0:30 [CIRC. AND COND. MUD FOR PARTICLE DRLG Cum. Bits: $ 76,000
BHA
BT 77/8 1.83
MM .13 2086 32.83
IBS 77/8 5.56
1-DC 6% 28.64
IBS 77/8 5.42
5-DC's 6% 149.08
26 WHDP 4% 798.68
necACIVED H-E JARS 62 31.34
CASTELGATE 11946 421 ahdahhaa ST 276.41
GRASSY 12196 671" NOV 2 0 2006 TOTAL BHA = 1329.79
SUNNYSIDE 12441 916’ Survey 2%° 10863’
24.00 |TD 13161 1636' DIV, OF O, GAS &MINING g, ryey 20 10525
P/U 240 K# LITH: 40% SH, 30% SS, 3 0% CALC. BKG GAS 3100
S/0 215 K# FLARE: 15' AFTER TRIPS ONLY GAS BUSTEF YES  CONN GAS 4221
ROT. 227 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3540 PEAK GAS 4578
FUEL Used: 1244 On Hand: 8868 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS
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AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 _ [Per.depth: 13,050 |Prog. depth: 13,161 11/20/2006 Days since spud: 19
Current: Operations: PARTICLE DRLG
Depth: __ 11617'_|Prog: 92  |pHrs: 7 |Av ROP: 131 |Formation:  LOWER MESAVERDE
DMC: $17,341 ITMC: $103,901 TDC: $53,491 jCWC: $1,395,735
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Imw: 9.9 |#1 PZ9 3.6 gpm IBit #: 9 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 69 ISPM: Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - |rigMove: $ -
Ipvivp: 23/45 |#2 PZ-9 3.6 gpm Type: 12B Jint. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 22,000
Gol: 22/42/55 |sem: 0 |mr: PDT [Prodcss:  $ - [Rental Tools: $ 1,500
WL: 7.8 GPM : 432 ISIN: 60290 [Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: "1/ [Press: 3500 Jets: 4X9.5 Well Head: $ - [water $ -
Solids: 10.5 Javoc: 308 7D Out: TBG/Rods: $ - lruer $ -
|mBT: 12.5 |avoe: 206 JDepth in: 11525 JPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ -
IPH : 9.0 JotVel: 110 IFTG: 92 Tanks: $ - ILogging: $ 800
IPfIMf: .2/6.6 |ecp: 11.03 IHrs: 7 Separator: $ - |cement $ -
IChlor: 1000 |sPri1: 50@500 IFPH: 13.1 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,500
lCa : 100 |sPR#2: WOB: 5/10 PumpingLi:  $ - lMud Motors: $ -
IDapp ppb: 52 IBtm.Up: 52 JR-RPM: 100 lPrIme Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 0 IMIsc: $ - Consultant: $ 850
START END TIME 5 Total Rot. Hrs: 304.5 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 17,341
06.00 12:00 6:00 JCIRC. COND. MUD FOR PARTICLE Misc. / Labor: $ 1,500
12:00 14:30 2:30 JWORK ON PARTICEL DRLG EQUIPMENT Csg. Crew: $ -
14:30 17.00 2:30 IDRLG 11525 TO 11545' (20' @ 8 FPH Daily Total: $ 53,491
17:00 18:00 1:00 JWORK ON PARTICEL DRLG EQUIPMENT Cum. Wir: $ 20,119
18:00 22:30 4:30 |DRLG 11545 TO 11579' (34 @7.5FPH iCum. Fuel $ 87,091
22:30 23:00 0:30 |CIRC. OUT SHOT Cum. Bits: $ 85,500
23:00 04.00 5:00 JDRLG 11579 TO 11617 (38' @ 7.6 FPH BHA
04:00 06:00 2:00 JWORK ON PARTICEL DRLG EQUIPMENT leit 77/8 1.00
BIT SUB 4.11
6- DC'S 6% 177.72
26 WHDP 4% 798.68
|H-E JARS 6% 31.34
fo-whop | % 276.41
RECEIVED
CASTELGATE 11946 329 NUm—ZW
GRASSY 12196 579" o TOTAL BHA = 1289.26
SUNNYSIDE 12441 824 e ITVL RS GMINING fsurvey | 2 | 10863
24.00 |TD 13161 1544’ Survey 2° 10525'
P/U 240 K# LITH: 40 % SH, 30 % SS, 3 0% CALC. BKG GAS 3100
S/0 215 K# FLARE: 15' AFTER TRIPS ONLY GAS BUSTEF NO CONN GAS 4221
ROT. 227 Ki# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3540 PEAK GAS 4578
FUEL Used: 1244 On Hand: 8868 Co.Man Scott Allred TRIP GAS
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AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 |Per.depth: 13,050 |[Prog. depth: 13,161 11/22/2006 Days since spud: 21
Current: Operations: DRLG
Depth: 11703 |Prog: 60 |D Hrs: 13 |AV ROP: 4.6 IFormation: LOWER MESAVERDE
lomc: $582 lTMe: $129,271 TDC: $32,262 |cwe: $1,479,435
[contractor: Nabors Rig 270 Imuaco: M-I Drig. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
IMW: 9.7 [#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm IBIt #: 10 IConductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 54 SPM: 113 Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 23/47 J#2pz-9 3.6 gpm Type: K705 Iint. csg: $ - |pay Rate: $ 22,000
Gel: 22/43/52 |sPm: 0 IMFG: STC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,500
W 82 |opm: 416 |siv: JX0391 [Froatequp: - [trucking: $ 812
Cake: 1/ IPress: 3500 Jets: 1.2 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 3,602
Solids: 8.5 AV DC: 308 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
iMBT: 12 AV DP: 206 Depth In: 11643 JPackers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -
IPH : 9.0 JetVel: 110 IFTG: 60 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ 800
IPfIMf: .2/6.0 ]eco: 10.98 IHrs: 13 Separator: $ - |cement: $ -
IChIor: 1000 ISPR #1: 50@500 IFPH: 4.6 Heater: $ - |IBits: $ -
ICa : 100 ISPR #2: lWOB: 20 PumpingLIT:  $ - IMud Motors: $ 1,300
IDapp ppb: 5 IBtm.Up: 55 IR-RPM: 65 IPrIme Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. lM-RPM: 416 IMIsc: $ - Consultant: $ 850
START END TIME 5 Total Rot. Hrs: 323.5 IDaIIy Total: $ - |orilling Mud: $ 582
06:00 06:30 0:30 [TRIP OUT OF HOLE Misc. / Labor: $ 816
06:30 07:00 0:30 JCHANGE OUT MM,BIT Ing. Crew: $ -
07:00 08:30 1:30 |TRIP IN TO SHOE - CIRC IDaIIy Total: $ 32,262
08:30 11:30 3:00 JRIG DOWN PARTICLE ,CHANGE LINERS IN PUMPS Cum. Wir: $ 23,721
11:30 13:00 1:30_|TRIP OIN HOLE@7850° Cum. Fuel $ 87,091
13:00 13:30 0:30 |BREAK CIRCULATION Cum. Bits: $ 85,500
13:30 15:00 1:30 JTRIP IN HOLE@11358" - INSTALL ROTATING HEAD BHA
156:00 16:00 1:00 |REAM BRIDGE @11358 -11418 BIT 77/8 1.00
16:00 17:00 1:00 JTRIP IN HOLE - REAM 30" TO BOTTOM MM 1.0 31.74
17:00 06:00 13:00 [DRLG F/ 11643 - 11703 (60°'@ 4.6FPH) 6- DC'S 6% 177.72
26 WHDP 4% 798.68
DA/l JHEJARS | 6% 31.34
il 4% 276.41
NOV Z 2 2006
CASTELGATE 11946 243" UL GAS & MINING
GRASSY 12196 493' TOTAL BHA = 1316.89
SUNNYSIDE 12441 738' Survey
24.00 |TD 13161 1458' Survey
P/U 245 K# LITH: 25 % SH, 75%SS, 5% Coal BKG GAS 600
S/IO0 215 K# FLARE: 10" trip flare GAS BUSTEF NO CONN GAS 1544
ROT. 230 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3540 PEAK GAS 1585
FUEL Used: 955 On Hand: 5424 Co.Man Rick Felker TRIP GAS 1585
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DAILY DRILLING REPORT ST%0
Energy Y 3-0l(3- 3309
AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 |Per.depth: 13,050 ([Prog. depth: 13,161 11/23/2006 Days since spud: 22
Current: Operations: DRLG
Depth: _ 11801' [Prog: 98 |pHrs: 2312 |AvROP: 42  |Formation:  LOWER MESAVERDE
DMC: $3,709 lT™C: $132,980 TDC: $44,063 |cwe: $1,523,498
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drig. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 9.8 |#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm foits: 10 Conductor: $ - |roc,cost: $ -
VIS: 51 SPM: 113 Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
{PVIYP: 18/37 |#2pPz9 3.6 gpm Type: K705 lint. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 22,000
Gel: 18/40/48 |sPm: 0 MFG: STC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,500
WL: 8.2 GPM : 416 SIN: JX0391 IFloat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/ |Press: 2054 Jets: 1.2 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Isolids: 9 AV DC: 316 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuer: $ 12,854
IMBT: 12 AV DP: 212 |Depth in: 11643 JPackers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -
IPH : 9.0 JetVel: 87 IFTG: 158 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ 800
IPfIMf: .216.2 JECD: 10.98 IHrs: 36 1/2 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 1000 ISPR #: 50@500 lFPH: 4.3 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca : 100 ISPR #2: WOB: 20/25 PumpingLIT:  $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,350
|Dapp ppb: 5.1 IBtm.Up: 53 |R-RPM: 65 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [M-RPM: 416 IMIsc: $ - |Consultant: $ 850
START END TIME 5 Total Rot. Hrs: 347.0 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 3,709
06:00 15:30 9:30 |DRLG F/ 11703 - 11741 (38°@ 4 FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ -
15:30 16:00 0:30 JRIG SERVICE Ing. Crew: $ -
16:00 06:00 14:00 |DRLG F/11741 - 11801 (60‘@4.2FPH) IDain Total: $ 44,063
06:00 foum. wr: $ 23,721
0 fcum. Fuel $ 99,945
0 Cum. Bits: $ 85,500
0 BHA
0 lsir 77/8 1.00
[mm 1.0 31.74
6- DC'S 6% 177.72
26 WHDP 4% 798.68
H-E JARS 6Y2 31.34
9- WHDP 4% 276.41
g e g s < pren o
e ¥ ol
CASTELGATE 11946 145' NOV 2 ! 200R
GRASSY 12196 395’ TOTAL BHA = 1316.89
SUNNYSIDE 12441 640 SEOE O CAS LR DN Burvey
24.00 |TD 13161 1360’ Survey
Al 245 K# LITH: 10 % SH, 90 % SS, BKG GAS 800
S/0 215 K# FLARE: N/A GAS BUSTEF NO CONN GAS 1831
ROT. 230 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3540 PEAK GAS 3241
FUEL Used: 1564 On Hand: 8600 Co.Man Rick Felker TRIP GAS N/A
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AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 |Per.depth: 13,050 |Prog. depth: 13,161 11/24/2006 Days since spud: 23
Current: Operations: DRLG
[pepth:  11905' [Prog: 104 [pHrs: 2312 [avROP: 4.4 |Formstion: __LOWER MESAVERDE
DMC: $2,000 ITMC: $134,980 TDC: $32,100 |CWC: $1,555,598
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 |Mud Co: M-I Drig. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW 9.8 I#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm IBit #: 10 Conductor: $ Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 51 lSPM: 114 Size: 77/8 Jsurt. csg: $ Rig Move: $ -
Ipvivp: 19/39 I#Z PZ-9 3.6 gpm Type: K705 Ilnt. Csg: $ Day Rate: $ 22,000
Gel: 15/34/43 |spm: 0 |vFe: STC IProd Csg: $ Rental Tools: $ 1,500
WL: 9 GPM : 420 SIN: JX0391 Fioat Equp: $ Trucking: $ 2,600
Cake: 1/ JPress: 2137 Jets: 1.2 Well Head: $ Water: $ -
Solids: 9 AV DC: 319 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ Fuel: $ -
ImeT: 12 AV DP: 214 [Depth in: 11643 Packers: 3 Mud Logger: $ -
IPH : 9.0 JetVel: 88 IFT G: 262 Tanks: $ Logging: $ 800
|;fIMf: .2/6.0 [ecp: 10.63 IHrs: 60 Separator: $ Cement: $ -
Chlor: 1000 lSPR #1: 50@500 IFPH: 4.4 Heater: $ Bits: $ -
Ca : 100 SPR#2 : WOB: 25/28 Pumping L/T: $ Mud Motors: $ 2,350
Dapp ppb: 5 |Btm.Up: 53 JR-RPM: 65 IPrime Mover: $ Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 420 IMIsc: $ Consultant: $ 850
START END TIME 5 Total Rot. Hrs: 370.5 IDaIIy Total: $ Drilling Mud: $ 2,000
06:00 13:30 7:30 |DRLG F/ 11801- 11837 (36'@4.8 FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ -
13:30 14:00 0:30 JRIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: $ -
14:00 06:00 16:00 |DRLG F/ 11837 - 11905 (68" @4.3FPH) Daily Total: $ 32,100
06:00 Cum. Wtr: $ 23,721
0 Cum. Fuel $ 99,945
0 Cum. Bits: $ 85,500
0 BOILER DOWN HASN'T BEEN FIXED YET ON THIS WELL BHA
0 IsiT 77/8 1.00
MM 1.0 31.74
IBS 6% 5.56
6- DC'S 6Ys 177.72
26 WHDP 4% 798.68
H-E JARS 6%2 31.34
9- WHDP 4% 276.41
I EID)
CASTELGATE 11946 41' NGV 2006
GRASSY 12196 297 ' TOTAL BHA = 1322.45
SUNNYSIDE 12441 536' (Y OF 0L QA et ASurvey
24.00 |10 13161 1256' ’ ~Isurvey
P/U 245 K# LITH: 20 % SH, 80 % SS, BKG GAS 800
S/0 215 K# FLARE: N/A GAS BUSTEF CONN GAS 4143
ROT. 230 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3540 PEAK GAS 4143
FUEL Used: 1604 On Hand: 6996 Co.Man Rick Felker TRIP GAS N/A
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T 105 R 105 Sa0
Y 3-0)3- 33081
GPS N. 39°55'26.5"

W110°01'02.59.6"

Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 _ [Per.depth: 13,050 [Prog. depth: 13,161 11/25/2006 IDays since spud: 24
Current: Operations: DRLG
Depth: __ 12064' |Prog: 66 |pHrs:  231/2 |avRop: 28  |Formation: CASTLEGATE
DMC: $2,587 lTMc: $140,433 TDC: $45,535 |cwc: $1,631,499
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 lMud Co: M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
IMw: 9.8 |#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm IBit #: 10 Conductor: 3 - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 50 SPM: 114 Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
fpvivp: 19/33 [#2pPz9 3.6 gpm Type: K705 Jint. Csg: $ - |pay Rate: $ 22,000
Gel: 15/33/41 |sPm: 0 jvrc: STC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,500
WL: 8.4 GPM : 420 ISIN: JX0391 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/ JPress: 2270 Jets: 1.2 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 9.5 Javbc: 319 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - [Fuen: $ 11,564
ImBT: 12 AV DP: 214 Jpepth In: 11643 Jrackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 800
IPH : 9.0 JetVel: 88 IFTG: 421 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
lpoms: .2/5.8 Jecp: 10.6 IHrs: 107 Separator: $ -  |cement: $ -
Chlor: 1000 ISPR #: IFPH: 3.9 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca : 100 SPR#2 : WOB: 25/28 PumpingLm: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,350
|Dapp ppb: 4.9 |Btm.Up: 53 JR-RPM: 50/70 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 420 IMIsc: $ - Consultant: $ 850
START END TIME 5 Total Rot. Hrs: 417.5 IDain Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,587
06:00 15:00 9:00 JDRLG F/ 11998 - 12028 (30°'@3.3FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ 3,884
15.00 15:30 0:30 |RIG SERVICE Ing. Crew: $ -
15:30 06:00 14:30 |DRLG F/12028 - 12064 (36'@2.4 FPH) Daily Total: $ 45,535
06:00 Jcum. wir: $ 23,721
0 cum. Fuel $111,509
0 Cum. Bits: $ 85,500
0 BHA
0 | Clks 77/8 1.00
fmm 1.0 31.74
IBS 6% 5.56
Fo T T 6- DC'S 6% 177.72
. 26 WHDP 4% 798.68
ms |H-E JARS 62 31.34
P X 276.41
T 7, 1 S iieg Aotined WA VDA
GRASSY 12196 132 TOTAL BHA = 1322.45
SUNNYSIDE 12441 377 Survey
24.00 |TD 13161 1097' Survey
| (1Y) 245 K# LITH: 30 % SH, 70 % SS, BKG GAS 600
S/0 215 K# FLARE: N/A GAS BUSTEF NO CONN GAS 6345
ROT. 230 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3540 PEAK GAS 6345
JFUEL  Used: 1631 On Hand: 7750 Co.Man  Rick Felker TRIP GAS N/A
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AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 |Per.depth: 13,050 |Prog. depth: 13,161 11/26/2006 Days since spud: 25
Current: Operations: DRLG
Depth: 12129 [I:’I"Og 65 |D Hrs: 9 IAV ROP: 7.2 IFormation: CASTLEGATE
DMC: $4,745 |TMC: $145,178 TDC: $35,712 |CWC: $1,667,211
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 Imud co: M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Imw: 9.8 |#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm IBit #: 10 11 Conductor: $ - |roc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 49 SPM: 114 ISize: 77/8 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
|PVIYP: 22/34 J#2pz9 3.6 gpm Type: K705 DSX199 ]int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 22,000
Gel: 15/34/42 |spm: 0 IMFG: STC HYC IProd Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,500
WL: 8.4 GPM : 420 SIN: JX0391 108390 [Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/ Press: 2270 Jets: 1.2 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 9.5 Javpe: 319 TD Out: 12069 TBG/Rods: $ - [Fuek $ -
|mBT: 12 AV DP: 214 loepth in: 11643 12069  |rackers: $ - IMud Logger: $ 800
IPH : 9.0 JetVel: 88 IFTG: 426 60 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: .2/5.8 |eco: 10.72 IHrs: 109 1/2 6.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 1000 |sPR#1: 50/600 IFPH: 3.9 9.2 Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
lca : 100 |spr#2: 40/475  |wos: 25/28 20/25 lpumpingLm: $ - |MudMotors: $ 900
lDapp ppb: 4.9 |Btm.up: 53 IR-RPM: 50/70 50/60 IPrIme Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. lM-RPM: 420 53 IMisc: $ - Consultant: $ 850
START END TIME 5 Total Rot. Hrs: 428.5 IDain Total: $ - Drifling Mud: $ 4,745
06:00 08:30 2:30 |DRLG F/ 12064 - 12069 (5°@2FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ 4,917
08:30 09:00 0:30 |PUMP PILL, DROP SURVEY Csg. Crew: $ -
09:00 14:30 5:30 |TRIP OUT OF HOLE Daily Total: $ 35,712
14:30 15:00 0:30 JLAY DOWN MM,BIT Cum. Wir: $ 23,721
15:00 16:00 1:00 JPULL CHECK WEAR BUSHING (STUCK IN WELL BORE -BB SHOTS)  [Cum. Fuel $111,509
16:00 16:30 0:30 |PICK UP MM,BIT [Cum. Bits: $ 85,500
16:30 22:30 6:00 JTRIP IN HOLE BHA
22:30 23:30 1:00 JWASH 90° TO BOTTOM IsIT 77/8 1.00
23:30 06:00 6:30 |DRLG F/12069 - 12129 (60" @ 9.2FPH) IMM 0.13 32.94
IBS 6% 5.56
6- DC'S 6% 177.72
26 WHDP 4V 798.68
I lh-eJars | &% 31.34
9- WHDP 4% 276.41
NOV-27-2006
—er— e b ey
GRASSY 12196 67' TOTAL BHA = 1323.65
SUNNYSIDE 12441 312 Survey 21/2 12069’
24.00 |TD 13161 1032 Survey
P/V 250 K# LITH: 15 % SH, 85%SS, TRC SLTST BKG GAS 450
S/0 230 K# FLARE: 30" TRIP FLARE GAS BUSTEF NO CONN GAS 3290
ROT. 240 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3540 PEAK GAS 3290
FUEL Used: 1109 On Hand: 6642 Co.Man Rick Felker TRIP GAS 1406
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AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 |Per.depth: 13,050 |Prog. depth: 13,161 11/28/2006 Days since spud: 27
Current: Operations: DRLG
Depth: __ 12252' [prog: 123 |pHrs: 24 |avRoP: 51 |rormation: _ BLACKHAWK - DESERT
lomc: $3,033 lTmc: $148,211 TDC: $37,683 Jewe: $1,704,894
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 9.9 I#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm IBIt #: 11 [Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 47 SPM: 114 Size: 77/8 ISurf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
lpvivp: 20/25 J2pPz9 3.6 gpm Type: DSX199 Ilnt. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 22,000
Gel: 11119/27 |sem: 0 JMFG: HYC lProd Csg: $ - |Rentai Tools: $ 1,500
WL: 8 GPM : 420 SIN: 108390 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
jcake: 1/ Press: 2298 Jots: 6X16 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 9.8 {avoc: 319 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuen: $ -
IMBT: 10.4 AV DP: 214 JDepth in: 12069 JPackers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 800
IPH : 9.5 JetVel: 114 IFTG: 183 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: .2/5.4 [eco: 10.73 IHrs: 30 1/2 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
IChlor: 2000 ISPR #1: 50/600 IFPH: 6.0 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,500
ICa : 100 ISPR #2: 40/475 WOB: 25/28 Pumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
IDapp ppb: 4.6 IBtm.Up: 53 {R-RPM: 50/60 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. Im-rem: 53 IMisc: $ - Consultant: $ 850
START END TIME 5 Total Rot. Hrs: 452.5 IDaIIy Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 3,033
06:00 18:00 12:00 |DRLG F/12129 - 12185 (56’ @4.6FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ -
18:00 06:00 12:00 ]DRLG F/ 12185 - 12252 (67°@5.5FPH) Ing. Crew: $ -
06:00 [Daity Total: $ 37,683
0 |6um. Wr: $ 23,721
0 leum. Fuer $111,509
0 Cum. Bits: $ 95,000
0 BHA
0 s 77/8 1.00
MM 0.13 32.94
IBS 6% 5.56
RECEIVED 6- DC'S 6Ya 177.72
i 26 WHDP | 4% 798.68
NOV Z 8 2006 |euars | 6% 31.34
L 9- WHDP 4% 276.41
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING
GRASSY 12316 64’ TOTAL BHA = 1323.65
SUNNYSIDE 12441 189' Survey 21/2 12069’
24.00 |TD 13161 909' Survey
P/U 250 Ki# LITH: 40% SH, 15% SS, 5% SLTST 40% COAL BKG GAS 500
S/0 230 K# FLARE: N/A GAS BUSTEF NO CONN GAS 3922
ROT. 240 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3540 PEAK GAS 3922
JFUEL Used: 1728 On Hand: 4914 Co.Man Rick Felker TRIP GAS N/A
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AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Weli: WRF 24-20-10-17 _ [Per.depth: 13,050 [Prog. depth: 13,161 11/29/2006 |Days since spud: 28
Current: Operations: DRLG
[Depth:  12279' [Prog: 27 lows: 7 |av rRoP: 39 |rormation:  BLACKHAWK - DESERT
DMC: $3,714 |TMC: $151,925 TDC: $56,538 |cwc: $1,761,432
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 10 I#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm IBit #: 11 12 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 50 lSPM: 114 Size: 77/8 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
IPviYP: 23/32 I#2 PZ-9 3.6 gpm Type: DSX199 D616 Jint. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 22,000
Gel: 14/26/37 |spm: 0 |vFa: HYC VAREL IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,500
Wi 8 |oewm: 420 |sm: 108390 3611 [FloatEqup: _ $ - [Trucking: $ 626
Cake: 1/ |Press: 2298 Jets: 6X16 6X18 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 5,048
Solids: 7.8 Javbc: 319 TD Out: 12279 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
IMBT: 11 AV DP: 214 Depth in: 12069 12279  [Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 800
[PH H 9.0 JetVel: 114 IFTG: 219 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: .2/5.9 [eco: 10.77 IHrs: 37 1/2 Separator: $ - |cement: $ -
Chior: 1000 ISPR #1: 50/600 IFPH: 5.8 Heator: $ - |sits: $ 22,000
Ca : 120 ISPR #2: 40/475  [woB: 25/28 PumpingLT:  $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 5 IBtm.Up: 54 Jr-rRPM: 50/60 IPrIme Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |m-RPM: 53 lMisc: $ - |consultant: $ 850
START END TIME 5 Total Rot. Hrs: 459.5 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 3,714
06:00 13:00 7:00 |DRLG F/ 12252 - 12279 (27" @3.8FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ -
13:00 13:30 0:30 |PUMP PILL Csg. Crow: 3 -
13:30 18:30 5:00 |TRIP OUT FOR BIT Dalily Total: $ 56,538
18:30 19:30 1:00 JCHANGE QUT MM,BIT , FUNCTION TEST PIPE,ANNULAR Cum. Wir: $ 28,769
19:30 22:00 2:30 JTRIP IN TO SHOE Jcum. Fuel $111,509
22:00 23:30 1:30 JUNTHAW STANDPIPE - DOWN TIME lcum. Bits: $117,000
23:30 01:00 1:30 JCUT DRLG LINE - 131 BHA
01:00 02:30 1:30 |DE -ICE RIG FLOOR | EIL 77/8 1.00
02:30 04:30 2:00 |TRIP IN HOLE IMM 0.13 32.94
04:30 05:00 0:30 |FILL PIPE -BLOW DOWN KELLY IBS 6% 5.56
05:00 06:00 1:00 |TRIP IN HOLE 6- DC'S 6% 177.72
RECEIVED 26 WHDP | 4% 798.68
NG'V—?'Q—ZBBE |H-E JARS 6% 31.34
' v 9- WHDP LYA 276.41
4 OF Ol GAS & MINING
GRASSY 12316 37 TOTAL BHA = 1323.65
SUNNYSIDE 12441 162' Survey 21/2 12069’
24.00 |TD 13161 882 Survey
P/U 250 Ki# LITH: 0% SH, 10% SS, 0% SLTST 90% COAL BKG GAS 500
S/I0 230 K# FLARE: N/A GAS BUSTEF NO CONN GAS 3897
ROT. 242 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3540 PEAK GAS 3897
|FUEL Used: 1583 On Hand: 3331 Co.Man  Rick Felker TRIP GAS N/A




BASCO GASCOENERGY . o
‘E"Hé“f_— DAILY DRILLING REPORT Y 3013~ 3309
gy AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 |Per.depth: 13,050 |Prog. depth: 13,161 11/30/2006 Days since spud: 29
Current: Operations: DRLG
Depth: 12513’ |Prog: _ 234 |pHrs: 2012 |avRoOP: 114 [Formation: SUNNYSIDE
jomMc: $878 |TMC: $152,803 TDC: $60,761 |CWC: $1,822,193
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
IMW: 10 I#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm IBIt #: 12 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 52 SPM: 114 Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 24/29 [#2pPz9 3.6 gpm Type: D616 Jint. Csg: $ - |DayRate: $ 22,000
Gel: 11/23/36 |sPm: 0 IMFG: VAREL IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,500
(WL: 8 GPM : 420 SIN: 3611 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/ [Press: 2250 Jets: 6X18 IWell Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 10.8 |avopc: 319 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel: $ 22,533
IMBT: 11.6 AV DP: 214 JDepth In: 12279 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 800
I;: 9.0 JetVel: 114 IFTG: 234 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
EMf: .2/5.5 |ecob: 10.77 lHrs: 20 1/2 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 1000  |sPR#1: 50/600 _|Feh: 11.4 Heater: $ - leis: $ 9,500
Ca : 120 SPR #2 : WOB: 25/28 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,700
|Dapp ppb: 4.8 Btm.Up: 54 JR-RPM: 50/60 IPrlme Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 53 IMisc: $ - Consultant: $ 850
START END TIME 5 Total Rot. Hrs: 480.0 IDaily Total: $ = |Drilling Mud: $ 878
06:00 | 07:30 1:30 JTRIP IN HOLE Misc. / Labor: $ -
07:30 08:00 0:30 JINSTALL ROTATING HEAD Csg. Crew: $ -
08:00 09:00 1:00 |REAM F12251 - 12279 Daily Total: $ 60,761
09:00 16:00 7:00 |DRLG F/12279 - 12411 (132°@18.8FPH) ICum. Wir: $ 28,769
16:00 16:30 0:30 JRIG SERVICE Cum. Fuel $134,042
16:30 06:00 13:30 JDRLG F/ 12411- 12513 (102°@7.7FPH) Cum. Bits: $126,500
06:00 BHA
0 BIT 77/8 1.00
[mm 0.13 32.94
_ IBS 6% 5.56
RECEIVED 6-DCS | 6% |  177.72
! 26 WHDP 4% 798.68
W |nesars | 6% 31.34
BI-OF-Ol- GAS X MINING 9- WHDP 4% 276.41
TOTAL BHA = 1323.65
SUNNYSIDE 12441 -72' Survey 2172 12069'
24.00 |ITD 13161 648' Survey
P/U 250 K# LITH: 20% SH, 60% SS, 0% SLTST 20% COAL BKG GAS 600
S/I0 230 K# FLARE: 15'TRIP FLARE GAS BUSTEF NO CONN GAS 2870
ROT. 242 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3540 PEAK GAS 2870
FUEL Used: 1731 On Hand: 10200 Co.Man Rick Felker TRIP GAS 685
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AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 |Per.depth: 13,050 |Prog. depth: 13,161 12/1/2006 Days since spud: 30
Current: Operations: DRLG
Depth: 12628' IProg: 115 ID Hrs: 9 IAV ROP: 12.8 IFormation: SUNNYSIDE
DMC: $2,613 |TMC: $155,416 TDC: $38,563 |CcwC: $1,860,756
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 10.1 I#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm lBit #: 12 13 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 52 SPM: 114 Size: 77/8 77/8 Jsurt. csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 24/26 J#2pPz-9 3.6 gpm Type: D616 D616 Ilnt. Csg: $ -  |Day Rate: $ 22,000
Gel: 11/20/29 |sPm: 0 IMFG: VAREL VAREL |Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1 ,500
WL: 7.8 GPM : 420 SIN: 3611 3670 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 1,800
[Cake: 1/ |Press: 2282 Jets: 6X18 6X18 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 10.4 Javoc: 319 TD Out: 125626 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
|mBT: 11.4 JavDP: 214 Ipepth in: 12279 12526  |packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 800
IPH : 9.0 JetVel: 114 IFTG: 247 102 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
IPfle: .2/6  JecD: 10.84 IHrs: 23172 6 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
IChlor: 1000 |sPr#1: 50/600 IFPH: 10.5 17.0 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,000
ICa : 120 SPR #2 : IWOB: 25/28 20 Pumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
IDapp ppb: 51 |Btm.Up: 55.4 IR-RPM: 50/60 60 IPrlme Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 53 53 IMisc: $ - Consultant: $ 850
START END TIME 6..5 Total Rot. Hrs: 483.5 F)aily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 2,613
06:00 09:00 3:00 |DRLG F/12513 - 12526 (13'@4.3FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ -
09:00 09:30 0:30 JPUMP PILL , SURVEY Ing. Crew: $ -
09:30 14:30 5:00 JTRIP OUT OF HOLE IDaily Total: $ 38,563
14:30 15:00 0:30 JCHECK WEAR BUSHING, FUNCTION ANNULAR Cum. Wir: $ 28,769
15:00 15:30 0:30 |CHANGE OUT MM,BIT, LAYDOWN IBS Cum. Fuel $134,042
15:30 19:00 3:30 |TRIP INHOLE Cum. Bits: $135,500
19:00 19:30 0:30 JFILL PIPE @4350 BHA
19:30 20:00 0:30 ]JRIG SERVICE s 77/8 1.00
20:00 21:30 1:30 |TRIP IN HOLE IMM 0.13 33.00
21:30 22:00 0:30 _|FILL PIPE@8965 IBS 6% 5.56
22:00 23:30 1:30 JTRIP IN HOLE - INSTALL ROTATING HEAD 6- DC'S 6% 177.72
23:30 00:00 0:30 |[REAM TO BOTTOM F/12463 - 12526 - NO FILL 26 WHDP 4% 798.68
00:00 06:00 6:00 |DRLG F/12526 - 12628 (102’ @17FPH) H-E JARS 6%z 31.34
o 9- WHDP 4% 276.41
RECEIVED
DEC-8-1-2006
TOTAL BHA = 1323.71
DL OF Ol GASKMINING  |Survey 12 12526
24.00 |TD 13161 533’ Survey
P/U 250 K# LITH: trc- SH, 75% SS, 20% SLTST 5% COAL BKG GAS 400
S/0 230 K# FLARE: 30'TRIP FLARE GAS BUSTEF NO CONN GAS 1792
ROT. 242 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3540 PEAK GAS 3128
JFUEL Used: 1109 On Hand: 9091 Co.Man Rick Felker TRIP GAS 2355
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AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 |Per.depth: 13,050 |(Prog. depth: 13,161 12/2/2006 Days since spud: 31
Current: Operations: DRLG
Depth: __ 13028' [Prog: 400 |owrs: 2312 |avroe: 17.0  |Formation: ABERDEEN
DMC: $2,334 ITMC: $157,750 TDC: $37,269 |CWC: $1,898,925
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
IMw: 10.2 |#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm |Bit #: 13 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 49 SPM; 114 ISize: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
Ipviye: 20/25 W2pPz9 3.6gpm Type: D616 Jint. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 22,000
Gel: 9/21/32 |sPm: 0 JMFG: VAREL IProd Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1 ,500
WL: 8.4 GPM : 420 SIN: 3670 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 2,435
Cake: 1/ Press: 2282 Jets: 6X18 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 5,000
Isolids: 11.2 JAvDC: 319 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel: $ -
IMBT: 10.4 JavDp: 214 [Depth In: 12526 JPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 800
IPH : 9.0 JetVel: 114 IFTG: 502 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: .2/5.9 [ecp: 10.8 IHrs: 291/2 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 1000 |[sPr#1: 50/600 IFPH: 17.0 Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
]Ca : 120 SPR#2: IWOB: 20/23 Pumping LT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,350
Dapp ppb: 4.8 |Btm.Up: 56.9 IR—RPM: 50/60 IPrlme Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |m-RPm: 53 IMisc: $ - |consultant: $ 850
START END TIME 6..5 Total Rot. Hrs: 512.0 IDaIIy Total: $ - {Drilling Mud: $ 2,334
06:00 15:30 9:30 |DRLG F/ 12628 - 12852 (224° @23.5FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ -
15:30 | 16:00 | 0:30 |RIG SERVICE Jcsg. crow: $ -
16:00 06:00 14:00 |DRLG F/ 12852 - 13028 (176’ @12.5FPH) Daily Total: $ 37,269
06:00 Jcum. war: $ 33,769
0 lcum. Fuel $134,042
0 lcum. sits: $131,458
0 BHA
0 leir 77/8 1.00
MM 0.13 33.00
BOILER FIRED THIS MORNING AND WORKING GOOD- NO HOURS IBS 6% 5.56
6- DC'S 6% 177.72
26 WHDP 4% 798.68
ST, |H-E JARS 6% 31.34
ReUEIVED 9- WHDP 4% 276.41
PEC-0-4-2006
DIV OF Oll, GAS & MINING __ |TOTAL BHA = 1323.74
Survey 2 12526’
24.00 |TD 13161 133 Survey
P/U 265 K# LITH: 60% SH, 40% SS, TRC% SLTST TRC% COAL BKG GAS 800
S/O 245 K# FLARE: 5" SPIRATIC WHILE ON VENT GAS BUSTEF NO CONN GAS 4268
ROT. 255 K# LLAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3540 PEAK GAS 4268
[FUEL Used: 1651 On Hand: 7440 Co.Man  Rick Felker TRIP GAS N/A
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AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 |Per.depth: 13,050 |Prog. depth: 13,161 12/3/2006 Days since spud: 32
Current: Operations: LOGGING
Depth: 13185 |Prog: 157 |D Hrs: 81/2 |AV ROP: 18.5 IFormatlon: D
DMC: $0 |TMC: $157,750 TDC: $25,485 |JCWC: $1,924,410
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-1 Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Imw: 10.2 I#1 PZ9 3.6 gpm IBit #: 13 Conductor: $ Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 50 SPM: 114 ISlze: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ Rig Move: $ -
pvivp: 20/25 [#2pPz-9 3.6 gpm Type: D616 Jint. Csg: $ Day Rate: $ 22,000
Gel: 9/21/32 |sPm: 0 jvFa: VAREL IProd Csg: $ Rental Tools: $ 1,500
WL: 8.4 GPM : 420 SIN: 3670 [Float Equp: $ Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/ |Press: 2282 Jets: 6X18 Well Head: $ Water: $ -
Solids: 11.2  ]avoc: 319 TD Out: 13185 TBG/Rods: $ Fuel: $ -
MBT: 10.4 AV DP: 214 JDepth In: 12526 IPackers: $ |Mud Logger: $ 285
IPH : 9.0 JetVel: 114 IFTG: 659 Tanks: $ ]Logging: $ -
PIMf: .2/5.9 |ecop: 10.8 IHrs: 38 Separator: $ Cement: $ -
Chlor: 1000 {sPR#: 50/600 IFPH: 17.3 Heater: $ Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 SPR #2 : WOB: 20/23 PumpingT: $ Mud Motors: $ 850
Dapp ppb: 4.8 IBtm.Up: 56.9 JR-RPM: 50/60 IPrime Mover: $ Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-rPM: 53 IMisc: $ Consultant: $ 850
START END TIME 6..5 Total Rot. Hrs: 520.5 IDain Total: $ Drilling Mud: $ -
06:00 14:30 8:30 |DRLG F/ 13028 - 13185 (157" @18.4FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ -
14:30 17:00 2:30 JCIRCULATE Csg. Crew: $ -
17:00 17:30 0:30 JPUMP PILL ,DROP SURVEY Daily Total: $ 25,485
17:30 23:30 6:00 |TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR LOGS Cum. Wir: $ 33,769
23:30 00:00 0:30 JLAYDOWN MM,JARS iCum. Fuel $134,042
00:00 00:30 0:30 |SAFTEY MEETING WITH LOGGERS ICum. Bits: $131,458
00:30 06:00 5:30 JLOGGING WITH SCHLUMBERGER - BHA
06:00 it 77/8 1.00
TD WELL ON 12/2/06 AT 14:30 Y 0.13 33.00
RELEASED MUD LOGGERS AT 15:30 ON 12/2/06 IBS 6% 5.56
LOGGERS DEPTH - 13195 6- DC'S 6% 177.72
26 WHDP 4% 798.68
JH-E JARS 6% 31.34
—ery Y 9- WHDP 4% 276.41
RECEIvVED
DEC_0 4 2006
TOTAL BHA = 1323.71
oV, OF OlL, GAS & MINING  fsyrvey 2 12526’
24.00 BOILER 24HRS  |Survey
P/U 265 K# LITH: 60% SH, 40% SS, TRC% SLTST TRC% COAL BKG GAS 800
S/0 245 K# FLARE: N/A GAS BUSTEF CONN GAS 4268
ROT. 255 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3540 PEAK GAS 4268
FUEL Used: 1454 On Hand: 5986 Co.Man Rick Felker TRIP GAS N/A
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AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 _ |Per.depth: 13,050 |Prog. depth: 13,161 12/4/2006 IDays since spud: 33
Current: Operations: LAYING DOWN DRILL PIPE AND COLLARS
IDepth: 13185' |Prog: 0 ID Hrs: 0 |AV ROP: #DIV/0! |Formation: TD
lomc: $3,029 lTmc: $160,779 TDC: $69,601 Jewe: $1,994,011
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 10.2 |#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm IBIt #: 13 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 50 ISPM: 114 Size: 77/8 [Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 20/25 |#2 PZ-9 3.6 gpm Type: D616 Ilnt. Csg: $ -  |Dpay Rate: $ 22,000
Gel: 9/21/32 |spm: 0 IMFG: VAREL IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,500
(WL 8.4 GPM : 420 ISIN: 3670 lFloat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/ |Press: 2282 Jets: 6X18 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 11.2  Javbc: 319 TD Out: 13185 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fue: $ -
MBT: 10.4 JAVDP: 214 [Depth In: 12526 JPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ -
IPH : 9.0 JetVel: 114 IFTG: 659 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ 42,222
IPfIMf: .2/5.9 |ecp: 10.8 IHrs: 38 Separator: $ - |cement: $ -
Chlor: 1000 ISPR #: 50/600 IFPH: 17.3 Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 SPR#2: IWOB: 20/23 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
[Dapp ppb: 4.8 [Btm.Up: 56.9 IR-RPM: 50/60 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |m-RPM: 53 IMisc: $ - |consuitant: $ 850
START END TIME 6..5 Total Rot. Hrs: 520.5 IDaIIy Total: $ - |Driiling Mud: $ 3,029
06:00 08:00 2:00 JLOGGING W/ SCHLUMBERGER -PE LATERAL LOG,DENSITY,BHC SONIC Misc. / Labor: $ -
08:00 09:00 1:00 JRIG LOGGERS DOWN Ing. Crow: $ -
09:00 15:30 6:30 |TRIP IN HOLE Daily Total: $ 69,601
15:30 16:00 0:30 JREAM TO BTM /13147 - 13185 - NO FILL Cum. Wtr: $ 33,769
16:00 18:00 2:00 |CIRC BTM UP/RIG UP LD MACHHINE Cum. Fuel $134,042
18:00 19:00 1:00 JSAFTEY MEEETING W/ CALIPER CASING CREW ,PUMP PILL Cum. Bits: $131,458
19:00 05:00 10:00 JLAYDOWN DRILL PIPE BHA
05:00 06:00 1:00 |BREAK KELLY lBiT 77/8 1.00
MM 0.13 33.00
IBS 6% 5.56
6- DC'S 6% 177.72
26 WHDP 4% 798.68
bEACIVVED lnevars | 6% 31.34
it fo-wrop | 4% 276.41
DEC 0 4 2006
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & WINING TOTAL BHA = 1323.71
BOILER 24 HRS |[Survey 2 12526
24.00 BOILER 48 HRS [Survey
P/U 265 K# LITH: 60% SH, 40% SS, TRC% SLTST TRC% COAL BKG GAS 800
S/0 245 Ki# FLARE: 10" TRIP FLARE GAS BUSTEF NO CONN GAS 4268
ROT. 255 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3540 PEAK GAS 4268
FUEL  Used: 1239  On Hand: 5986 Co.Man Rick Felker TRIP GAS N/A
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DAILY DRILLING REPORT
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AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 |Per.depth: 13,050 |Prog. depth: 13,161 12/5/2006 lDays since spud: 34
Current: Operations: CEMENTING CASING
Depth: __ 13185’ [Prog: 0  |DHrs: 0 [av ROP: #DIV/0! |Formation: D
DMC: $0 |TMc: $160,779 TDC: $102,357 |cwe: $2,386,262
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW I#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm IBit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
Jevive: J#2pPz-9 3.6 gpm Type: fint. Csg: $ - |payRate: $ 22,000
Gel: SPM: JMFG: IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,500
(WL: GPM : ISIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
ECake: |Press: Jets: Wel Head: $ 1 ,323 Water: $ -
Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuen $ -
MBT: AV DP: fDepth In: JPackers: $ - {Mud Logger: $ -
IPH H JetVel: IFTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ 42,222
IPfIMf: JECD: IHrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ =
IChIor: SPR#1: IFPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -
ICa : JSPR#2: (WOB: Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
IDapp ppb: IBtm.Up: IR-RPM: IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: IMisc: $ - Consultant: $ 850
START END TIME 6..5 Total Rot. Hrs: 520.5 IDain Total: $ 1,323 |Drilling Mud: $ 3,029
06:00 | 830 | 2:30 Jiay pownBHA Imisc. 1 Labor: $ -
8:30 9:00 0:30 |REMOVE WEAR BUSHING Ing. Crew: $ 31,433
9:00 10:30 1:30 JRU CASING CREW IDaily Total: $ 102,357
10:30 11:00 0:30 |MAKE UP SHOE AND FLOAT ICum. Wir: $ 33,769
11:00 22:00 11:00 JRUN 299 JTS, 4% - 13.5# - P110 CASING LANDED @ 13177 KB ICum. Fuel $134,042
22:00 24:00 2:00 {TAG @ 13180", MU HANGER DROP BALL Jcum. Bits: $131,458
24:00 03:30 3:30 JCIRC. OUT GAS FOR CEMENT BHA
03:30 04:00 0:30 JRUG UP CEMENT CREW
04:00 06:00 2:00 JR U SCHLUMBERGER & PUMP 20 BBL SPACER, 20BBL CW100
LEAD CLASS G+12%D20+1%D79+0.2%D167+0.2%D46+1.75%D13+
0.125pps D130--- 580SKS, 115.PPG YIELD 3.04, H20 18.4 GAL/SKS
TAIL 50/50 POZ CLASS G+ 2%D20 +0.1%D46+0.2%D198+0.2%D167+
RE .-F VFD 0.2%D65---- 1,345 SKS, 14.1 PPG,, YIELD 1.28 , H20 5.94 gal/sks
; DISPLACED W/ 197 BBLS OF KCL WATER
mi—m FULL RET. THRU OUT JOB - BUMPED PLUG WITH 1000 PSI OVER -
o OATS HELD - .
s GW@III/IT. IN PLACE @ 06:00 AM 12/05/06 TOTAL BHA = 0.00
Survey 2 12526
24.00 Survey
P/U 265 K# LITH: 60% SH, 40% SS, TRC% SLTST TRC% COAL BKG GAS 800
S/0 245 K# FLARE: 10" TRIP FLARE GAS BUSTEF YES CONN GAS 4268
ROT. 255 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3540 PEAK GAS 4268
IFUEL Used: 1239 On Hand: 5986 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS N/A
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GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
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AFE # 40144 GPS N. 39°55'26.5" W110°01'02.59.6"
Well: WRF 24-20-10-17 _ |Per.depth: 13,050 |Prog. depth: 13,161 12/7/2006 lDays since spud: 36
Current: Operations: RIG DOWN FINAL REPORT
Depth: _ 13185' |Prog: 0 |[oHrs: 0 |av roP: 4DIV/IO!  |Formation:
DMC: $0 ITMC: $160,779 TDC: $21,150 |cwc: $2,305,055
Contractor: Nabors Rig 270 IMud Co: M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Mw: I#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm IBit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: ISPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - |Rrig Move: $ -
JPVIYP: |#2 PZ-9 3.6 gpm Type: JInt. Csg: $ = Day Rate: $ 19,800
Gel: SPM: IMFG: IProd Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 500
WL: GPM : SIN: IFloat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: JPress: Jets: (Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuer $ -
IMBT: AV DP: |Depth In: JPackers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -
Ig'l H JetVel: IFTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
I:ﬂMf: JECD: IHrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
keior: SPR #1 : [Fen: Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
Ca : IsPR#2: woB: PumpingLUT:  $ - | Mud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: |Btm.Up: JR-RPM: IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T.  |M-RPM: IMisc: $ - |consultant: $ 850
START END TIME 6..5 Total Rot. Hrs: IDain Total: $ - Dritting Mud: $ -
06:00 18:00 12:00 |RIG DOWN AND MOVE TO WRF 32-20-10-17 Misc. / Labor: $ -
Csg. Crew: $ -
Daily Total: $ 21,150
fcum. war: $ 33,769
fcum. Fuel $134,042
fcum. Bits: $131,458
BHA
RECEIVED
BEC-0-/-2006-
DIV OF Ol , GAS & MINING TOTAL BHA = 0.00
Survey
24.00 Survey
lPiu K# LITH: BKG GAS
1s/o K# FLARE: GAS BUSTER CONN GAS
ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3540 PEAK GAS
JFUEL Used: 1239 On Hand: 5986 Co.Man Scott Allred TRIP GAS




CCNFIDENTIAL

GASCO GASCO ENERGY _
unouy T /0SK)E 5-R0
Energy DAILY DRILLING REPORT Y2015—3209)]
AFE # 40158 GPS -
Well: WRF 32-20-10-17 |Permit Depth: 13250 IProg. Depth: 13250 |Date: 12/12/2006 l Days Since Spud: RU5
Current Operations: RIG UP
Depth: __ 3564' |Prog: D Hrs: [avrRop:  #pvio!  [Formation: UINTA
DMC: ITMC: TDC: $22,300 jCWC: $478,651
Contractor:  Frontier Rig 6 Mud Co: M-l DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW I#1 PZ-9 3.6 gpm |Bit #: Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: SPM: ISize: Surf. Csg: $ - IRig Move: $ -
levivp: #2pPz9 3.6gpm Type: Jint. Csg: $ - IDay Rate: $ 19,800
IGeI: SPM: jvFG: IProd Csg: $ - [Rental Toos: $ 500
WL GPM : SIN: IFloat Equp: $ - [rrucking: $ -
Cake: |Press: JJets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - JFuel: $ -
IMBT: AV DP: |Depth In: JPackers: $ - lMud Logger: 3 -
IPH 4 JetVel: IFTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
IPfle: JECD: IHrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ =
Chlor: ISPR #: |epn: #DIV/0! |Heater: $ - [Bits: $ -
Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: IPumpIng L/T: $ - IMud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: |Btm.Up: JR-RPM: lPrime Mover: $ - ICorrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: IMisc: $ - IConsuItant: $ 1,000
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: IDaIIy Total: $ - IDriIIIng Mud: $ -
06:00 | 18:00 | 12:00 JRIG UP - WORK ON MUD TANK GET READY FOR SWACO TO SET NEWlMlsc. / Labor: $ 1,000
MUD CLEANING EQUIPMENT ON WED. HOOK UP LINES AND WORK Olcsg. Crew: $ -
HOUSE. STRING UP BLOCKS Daily Total: $ 22,300
JCum. Wtr: $ -
ICum. Fuel $ -
o~ ~EWVED Cum. Bits: $ -
~FE= Ve —
DEC 17 2006
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & iNG
WASATCH 5161' 1597
MESAVERDE 9341' 5777
CASTLEGATE 12016 8452
GRASSY 12401' 8837’ TOTAL BHA = 0.00
SUNNYSIDE 12551 8987' Survey
TD 13166’ 9602 Survey
P/U K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/0 K# FLARE: 5AS BUSTER NO CONN GAS
ROT. K# LAST CSG. RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3564' KB PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: OnHand: Co. Man Scott Allred _ TRII'-_‘_GAS
BIT # 1 CONDITION ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP
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Wilkin Ridge Federal 24-20-10-17 T SR 1Y SR0
> 0133398
Drilling CWC: $2,305,055 Hz-a5-3 7
Tk battery est cost: $88,000 CC $2,393,055
Completion — 1* Mobe — Entire wellbore
1
1/3/06 MIRU SLB Wireline and ran CBL/CCL/Gamma Ray/VDL logs. Found

good cmt into surface csg. RU B&C and psi tested csg to 9500 psi, ok.

1/4/067 RU SLB (Shawn Moon, Mike Tindel). RIH w/ guns to perforate Stage 1
— Kenilworth. Perff/ 12748 — 53’. Had some leaks and cold weather
problems. Design RTS 8:30 AM. Actual RTS 11:57 AM. Broke dn perfs
@ 6900 psi @ 5.2 bpm. ISIP 5450. FG .86. 5 min SIpsi 5418. Calc all
15 holes open. Screened out Stage 1 frac w/ 108,428# total sd in perfs (w/
111,428# 20-40 Optiprop, and 57,500 20-40 Versaprop) and 12,500#
Versaprop in csg. Got 97 bbls flush away (out of 188 bbls). Opened well
up to FB 1:30 PM w/ 4700 SICP, on 10 — 12/64” ck, to clean up screen
out. RIH w/ “Perf only” guns, and perforated f/ 12485 —92°, 11864 —
67’, 3 spf. Opened well back up to flowback for night. (SCE and CR).

1/5/07 Well flowing this AM @ 2200 psi on a 14/64 ck. Well flowed 642 bbls in
13 % hrs, TLR 642, BLWTR 1544. Close well in and rig up SLB wire line
and RIH w/ plug and guns. Set 8 k FTFP #1 @ 11,803 and pressure tested
to 4600 psi. Hold 3800 psi on well and perf stage 2 Lower Mesaverde I
@ 11,784-88°, 11,760-63°, 11,710-12°, 11,665-68’, 11,604-07’, with 3 1/8
Hi-Vol guns @ 3 spf, 120 deg spacing, .38 dia, 28" pen. Break down perfs
@ 7302 psi @ 5.3 bpm, FG .82, ISIP 4500 psi, calc shots open 28 / 45.
Pump 3500#’s of % pound and 4500#’s of % pound sand in pad. Bump gel
loading to 22 # as per Schlumberger request. Hybrid frac well w/ 2957
bbls of YF and WF122 gel and 125,750# of 20/40 Opti-Prop sand. Flush
well w/ 172.6 bbls, ISIP 4690, FG .83. Close well in and rig up wire line,
RIH w/ plug and guns. Set 8 k FTFP #2 @ 11,381’ and pressure test to
5500 psi. Bleed down to 4800 psi and shoot Stage # 3 Lower Mesaverde
I @ 11,262-66°, 11,288-90’, 11,361-66’. Break down perfs @ 6624 psi
@ 5.2 bpm, ISIP 4500 psi, FG .83. Hybrid frac stg 3 w/ 2292 bbls of YF
and WF115 gel and 91,100 # of 20/40 Opti Prop sand. Flush well w/ 149
bbls ( 16 bbls short of design) and well screened out. Turn well over to
flowback @ 2:20 pm @ 5400 psi on a 10/64 ck. Cleaned up wellbore and
PTCEIVED  RIH w/ plug and guns to perf Stage 4 — Lower Mesaverde I11. Had 2
bad runs before fixing gun string. Set FTFP #3 @ 11153". Psi tested plug
JAN 0 8 2007 to 5200 psi, 1000 over well psi. Held 50 — 100 psi over well psi and
. _ perforated f/ 10977 - 80°, 11023 —26’, 11061 — 64’, 11083 - 85°,
L Ui, GAS GNINING 11108 - 1107, 11134- 382, 3 spf. RU to frac. Broke dn perfs @ 4671 psi.
ISIP 4150. FG .81. Calc 26 holes open / 51. Hybrid frac sge 4 w/
120980# 20-40 Optiprop, using 2818 bbls WF and YF 115 gel. Flushed



1/6/07

w/ 161.7 bbls. ISIP 4425. FG .83. Opened well up to FB @ 10:45 PM,
on 10/64” ck w/ 3900 SICP. (SCE and CR)

Well flowing back this AM @ 3350 psi on a 16/64 ck. Well flowed 1243
bbls in 11 hrs, TA 1885, BLWTR 8368. Close well in and rig up SLB wire
line and RIH w/ plug and guns. Set 8k FTFP @ 10,656 and pressure test
to 4600 psi. Bleed well down to 3800 psi and shoot Upper Mesaverde @
10,522-32, 10,641-43’. Had to pump 2.5 bpm @ 4000 psi while pulling
out of hole with wireline. ISIP 4100 psi, FG .82, calc shots open @ 15/36.
Frac well w/ 1785 bbls on YF120 and 118 gel and 61,765# of 20/40
OptiProp sand. Flush well w/ 156.5 bbls, ISIP 4700 psi, FG .88. Close
well in and rig up SLB and RIH w/ guns for perf only run. Shoot perfs @
10,348-56’. POOH w/ wireline and pick up plug and guns for stage #6.
RIH and set 8 k FTFP @ 9495’ and pressure test to 5000 psi. Bleed well
down to 4200 psi and shoot Upper Mesaverde I1 @ 9460-70°. Rig down
wireline and rig up SLB frac crew. Break down perfs @ 6450 psi @ 5.2
bpm, ISIP 4725, FG .93, Calc shots open 14 / 30. Frac well w/ 1907 bbls
of YF120 and 118 gel and 66,596# of 20/40 SB Excel sand. Flush well w/
139.1 bbls, ISIP 5250, FG .99. Turn well over to flowback @ 6:30 pm @
4900 psion a 12/64 ck. (CR / SCE) DC $ 826,000 CC $ 3,219,055



Form 3160- § UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004- 0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007
5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-75083
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. I Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.
1. Type of Well Wilkin Ridge
Doil Well Gas Well D()lher 8. Well Name and No.
2. Name of Operator Wilkin Ridge Federal 24-20-10-17
Gasco Production Company 9. APl Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-013-33081
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (F-ootage, Sec.. 1., R., M., or Survey Description) Wilkin Rldge
. 11, County or Parish, State
SE SW of Section 20-T10S-R17E 491'FSL & 1789' FWL
Duchesne County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent DAcidize DDeepen DProduclion ( Start/ Resume) DWaler Shut-off
DAlten'ng Casing DFraclure Treat DReclamalion DWeII Integrity

DSubsequenl Report DCasing Repair DNew Construction DRecomplele DOlher
DChange Plans DPlug and abandon DTemporarily Abandon
I:]Final Abandonment Notice DConven to Injection DPlug back Wa(er Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete honzontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

This is to inform you that we will be disposing of water from this well as Sollows:

All produced water from this well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at
the Desert Spring State Evaporation Facility NW 1/4 of Section 36-T9S-R18E
Uintah County Utah. Which is owned by Gasco Production Company. A copy of
Gasco's approved permit is attached for your records.

Ve Drtsign o RECEIVED

oil, Gas and Mining JAN 2 2 2007
FOR RECORD ONLY

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

14. T hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.

Name (Printed Typed)
Title

Beverly Walkgy” ' Engineering Technician

Signature ; g Date
- ///MA January 9, 2007

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant of
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease]Office

which  would  entitle  the applicant _to  conduct _ operations___thereon,

Title 18 USC. Section 100} AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

{Instructions on page 2)
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Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004- 0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007
5. Lease Senal No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-75083

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. 1f Indian. Allottee. or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. 1f Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.
T Type of Well Wilkin Ridge
Oil Well Gas Well DOIher 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Wilkin Ridge Federal 24-20-10-17
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-013-33081
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool. or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R.. M., or Survey Descripiion) Wilkin R]dge

) i 11. County or Parish. State

SE SW of Section 20-T10S-R17E 491' FSL & 1789' FWL
Duchesne County, Utah

12, CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT. OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

DAcidize DDeepen
I:]Ahering Casing
DCasing Repair
DChange Plans

DConven to Injection

DNotice of Intent
Subsequcnl Report

D Plug back

I:]Final Abandonment Notice

D Fracture Treat
DNew Construction
DPlug and abandon

I:]Waler Shut-off
DWeII Integrity
DOIher

Produclion( Start/ Resume)
Dkeclamalion
DRecompIete

I:]Temporan'ly Abandon

DWater Disposal

. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state al)
If the proposal is 10 deepen directionally or recomplete horizontall
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multi
testing has been completed.  Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed onl
determined that the site isready for final inspection.

y, give subsurface |

provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Re
ple completion or recompletion ina new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
y after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.

ocations and measured and trve vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
quired subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days

This well was started on production on January 6, 2007

RECEIVED
JAN 2 Z 2007

DIV, OF QIL, GAS & MINING

14. I hereby centify that the foregoing is true and comect.

Name (Printed Typed)
’ Title
Beverly Walkér

Engineering Technician

Date

January 9. 2007

=

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by

Title

Date

Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title 1o those rights in the subject le:
which __would _ entitle  the applicam _to  conduct  operations  thereon|

Office

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 US.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for an
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its

y person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United

jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)
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Gasco Production Company
Wilkin Ridge Federal 24-20-10-17
SE SW of Section 20-T10S-R17E

Duchesne County Utah,
947-013-33081
Y3

Drilling CWC: $2,305,055
Tk battery est cost: $88,000 CC $2,393,055

Completion — 1** Mobe — Entire wellbore

1/3/06 MIRU SLB Wireline and ran CBL/CCL/Gamma Ray/VDL logs. Found
good cmt into surface csg. RU B&C and psi tested csg to 9500 psi, ok.

1/4/06 RU SLB (Shawn Moon, Mike Tindel). RIH w/ guns to perforate Stage 1
— Kenilworth. Perf f/ 12748 — 53°. Had some leaks and cold weather
problems. Design RTS 8:30 AM. Actual RTS 11:57 AM. Broke dn perfs
@ 6900 psi @ 5.2 bpm. ISIP 5450. FG .86. 5 min SI psi 5418. Calc all
15 holes open. Screened out Stage 1 frac w/ 108,428# total sd in perfs
(w/ 111,428# 20-40 Optiprop, and 57,500 20-40 Versaprop) and
12,500# Versaprop in csg. Got 97 bbls flush away (out of 188 bbls).
Opened well up to FB 1:30 PM w/ 4700 SICP, on 10 — 12/64” ck, to clean
up screen out. RIH w/ “Perf only” guns, and perforated f/ 12485 — 92°,
11864 — 67°, 3 spf. Opened well back up to flowback for night. (SCE and
CR).

1/5/07 Well flowing this AM @ 2200 psi on a 14/64 ck. Well flowed 642 bbls in

13 ¥ hrs, TLR 642, BLWTR 1544. Close well in and rig up SLB wire line

and RIH w/ plug and guns. Set 8 k FTFP #1 @ 11,803’ and pressure tested

to 4600 psi. Hold 3800 psi on well and Perf stage 2 Lower Mesaverde |

@ 11,784-88°, 11,760-63°, 11,710-12°, 11,665-68’, 11,604-07’, with 3 1/8

Hi-Vol guns @ 3 spf, 120 deg spacing, .38 dia, 28” pen. Break down perfs

@ 7302 psi @ 5.3 bpm, FG .82, ISIP 4500 psi, calc shots open 28 / 45.

Pump 3500#’s of 2 pound and 4500#’s of % pound sand in pad. Bump gel

loading to 22 # as per Schlumberger request. Hybrid frac well w/ 2957

bbls of YF and WF122 gel and 125,750# of 20/40 Opti-Prop sand.

Flush well w/ 172.6 bbls, ISIP 4690, FG .83. Close well in and rig up wire

line, RIH w/ plug and guns. Set 8 k FTFP #2 @ 11,381" and pressure test

to 5500 psi. Bleed down to 4800 psi and shoot Stage # 3 Lower

Mesaverde I @ 11,262-66°, 11,288-90°, 11,361-66’. Break down perfs

RECEIVED g 6624 psi @ 5.2 bpm, ISIP 4500 psi, FG .83. Hybrid frac stage 3 w/
FEB 7 3 2007 2292 bbls of YF and WF115 gel and 91,100 # of 20/40 Opti Prop sand.
Flush well w/ 149 bbls (16 bbls short of design) and well screened out.

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING Turn well over to flowback @ 2:20 pm @ 5400 psi on a 10/64 ck.
Cleaned up wellbore and RIH w/ plug and guns to perf Stage 4 — Lower

Mesaverde I1I. Had 2 bad runs before fixing gun string. Set FTFP #3 @



1/6/07

2/14/07

2/15/07

2/16/07

2/17/07

11153°. Psi tested plug to 5200 psi, 1000 over well psi. Held 50 — 100 psi
over well psi and perforated f/ 10977 — 80°, 11023 —26°, 11061 — 64°,
11083 — 85°, 11108 — 110°, 11134- 38, 3 spf. RU to frac. Broke dn
perfs @ 4671 psi. ISIP 4150. FG .81. Calc 26 holes open / 51. Hybrid
frac stage 4 w/ 120980# 20-40 Optiprop, using 2818 bbls WF and YF
115 gel. Flushed w/ 161.7 bbls. ISIP 4425. FG .83. Opened well up to
FB @ 10:45 PM, on 10/64” ck w/ 3900 SICP. (SCE and CR)

Well flowing back this AM @ 3350 psi on a 16/64 ck. Well flowed 1243
bbls in 11 hrs, TA 1885, BLWTR 8368. Close well in and rig up SLB wire
line and RIH w/ plug and guns. Set 8k FTFP @ 10,656’ and pressure test
to 4600 psi. Bleed well down to 3800 psi and shoot Upper Mesaverde @
10,522-32, 10,641-43’. Had to pump 2.5 bpm @ 4000 psi while pulling
out of hole with wireline. ISIP 4100 psi, FG .82, calc shots open @ 15/36.
Frac well w/ 1785 bbls on YF120 and 118 gel and 61,765# of 20/40
OptiProp sand. Flush well w/ 156.5 bbls, ISIP 4700 psi, FG .88. Close
well in and rig up SLB and RIH w/ guns for perf only run. Shoot perfs @
10,348-56’. POOH w/ wireline and pick up plug and guns for stage #6.
RIH and set 8 k FTFP @ 9495’ and pressure test to 5000 psi. Bleed well
down to 4200 psi and shoot Upper Mesaverde Il @ 9460-70°. Rig down
wireline and rig up SLB frac crew. Break down perfs @ 6450 psi @ 5.2
bpm, ISIP 4725, FG .93, Calc shots open 14 / 30. Frac well w/ 1907 bbls
of YF120 and 118 gel and 66,596# of 20/40 SB Excel sand. Flush well
w/ 139.1 bbls, ISIP 5250, FG .99. Turn well over to flowback @ 6:30 pm
@ 4900 psi on a 12/64 ck. (CR / SCE) DC $ 826,000 CC $ 3,219,055

MORU service unit, rig up pump and tank. Change out rams on BOP,
pump 30 bbls down csg and well pressured up to 3500 psi. turn well down
sales and SDFD. (CR) DC § 4,684 CC $ 3,223,739

Well flowing this AM @ 1100 psi. Try to kill well while waiting on
wireline unit. Rig up JW wireline and set kill plug @ 6000°, rig down
wireline and bleed down well. NDWH and NU BOP, rig up tbg
equipment. Pick up 3 % mill, POBS, X-nipple and RIH tallying off float.
Pick up 76 jts and SDFD. (CR) DC $ 5578 CC $ 3,229,317

Open well up this AM and continue RIH w/ tbg. Tag up on kill plug and
rig up swivel. Break circulation and drill out plug, well started flowing @
1800 psi. Set back swivel and RIH w/ 106 jts and tag FTFP, rig up swivel
and break circulation. Drilled through plug and lost circulation. Pumped
for 10 min and regained circulation, circ bottoms up and turn well over to
flowback for clean up. SDFD (CR) DC §$ 5429 CC $ 3,234,746

Open well this AM and RIH w/ tbg, tag sand bridge @ 10,150°. Rig up
swivel and break circ, wash out sand bridge and well started flowing @



1500 psi. RIH w/ tbg and drill out remainder of plugs. Tag up on PBTD
@ 12,900’ Circ bottoms up and POOH w/ 3 jts and land well @ 12,833’.
ND BOP and NUWH. Tum well over to flowback for clean up and
RDMO location. SDFD. (CR) DC § 5876 CC § 3,240,622
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Form 3160-4
(August 1999)

UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG

FORM APPROVED
OMB NO. 1004-0137
Expires: November 30, 2000

5. Lease Serial No.
UTU-75083

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
NA

7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.

1a. Type of Well 3 oitweit [ Gas Oby  other

b. Type of Completion: B New [ work over [ Deepen 3 Plue Back O oifr Resvr.
Other LA

2. Name of Operator JJ\'“—IUE\ I”.\L

Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridpe

8. Lease Name and Well No.

3. Address

8 Inverness Drive East Suite 10O, Loglewood. Colorado 80112

3a. Phone No. (include area code)

303-483-0044

Wilkin Ridge Federal 24-20-10-17

9. APl Well No.
43-013-33081

4. Location of Well (Report locations clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements) *

Atsurface

J91"ESE & 1789 FWIE, SELSW

Field and Pool. or Exploratory
Wilkin Ridge

1. Sec., T..R.. M. orBlock and

At top prod. interval reported below same Survey or Area  Sce 20-T10S-R 171

12. County or Parish 13. State
At total depth same Duchesne ltah
14. Date Spudded I5. Date T.D. Reached 16. Date Complete, 17. Elevations (DF. RKB. RT, GL)*

D&A

h Ready to Prod.

FO/1R/06 12:03:06 01:06:07 60216 G 00436 K13
I8. Total Depth: MD 13185 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 20. Depth Bridge Plug Set: MD NA
TVD 13183 TVD TVD NA
21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy of each) 22. Was well - B No [} Yes(Submit copy)
Was DST run? No [ Yes(Submit copy)
Directional m No O Yes (Submit copy)
23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all sirings set in well)
Hole Size } Size/Grade | Wi (#/f1.) Top (MD) Bottom (MD) Stage;)i;mhenler TY;; Z;it;::“ SI!(’;:;SOI' Cement Top* Amount Pulled
20" 1} 40
17 3/2" |13 3/8 HA( 48 0 220 275 sx of Class G Cire to Surl’
12 174" 18 5/8 1-55 R [0 3534 895 s\ of Class G Circ 1o Surf
778" 4 12P110 [RINE 1] 13177 380 sx of Class G Circ to Surf
1345 sx of 50-50
24. Tubing Record
Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) | Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) | Packer Set (MD)
2 38" 12833
5. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status
A) Blackhawk 12488 12753 Sce Attached
R) Mesaverde Y460 11867
o)
D)
E)
7. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc. R nE" ZEB
Depth Interval Amount and type of Material R
See Allached “AR 2 8 ZBB7
‘8. Production - Interval A
Jate First | Test Howrs Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
voduced (Date Tested Production [BBL MCF BBL Corr. APl Gravity
M/06/07]01/11:071 24 —> 67 1,383 147 Flowing
‘hoke Tbg. Press.  |Cse. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Wel Status
ize Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr. AP
sl ol 2313 |—>» | 67 1.383 147 Producing from A & B
‘8a.
ate First  [Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
roduced  [Date Tested Production {BBI. MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity
‘hoke Tbg. Press. [Cse. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Well Status
ize Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBI. Corr. AP1
s1 —>

See instructions and spaces for additional data on reverse side)



CCNFIDENTIAL

28b.
Date First |Test Hours Test QOil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced |Date Tested Production  }BBL MCF BBL Corr. APl
Choke Tbg. Press.  JCsg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio
sI —_>
28c. Production - Interval E
Date First [Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced |Date Tested Production  |BBL MCF BBL Corr. AP
Choke Tbe. Press.  {Csg. 24 Hr. QOil Gas Water Gas : Ol Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

S1

v

29. Disposition of Gas (Sold. used for fuel. vented. etc.)
Sold

30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem
tests. including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures
and recoveries.

Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name  _Top
) Meas. Depth
Wasatch 5.100 9,276
Dark Canyon 9,276 9.356
Mesaverde 9,356] 11,929
Blackhawk 12,193 Well was td'd within the Blackhawk @ 13,185

32. Additional remarks (include plugging procedure):

33. Circle enclosed attachments:
1. EleclricaI/Mechanical_ Logs (1 full set req'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Report 4. Directional Survey
5. Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification 5. Core Analysis 7. Other:

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and cormrect as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

Name (please pri Beverly Walker Title Engineering Tech

Y N

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

o US. GPO: 1999-573-624



CONFIDENTIAL

Wilkin Ridge Federal 24-20-10-17
Additional Information to Well Completion Report

27. Perforation Record

Perforated Interval Size 0. Hole] Perf. Status

%
12748-53; 12485-92 g 0.38 36 Open

11864-67; ll784-88;/| I760—63;, ] l710—12;/l 1665-68; | l604-07;/ 1 l36|—66;/l I288-90;/l 1262-66;”
11134-38;11108-10;"11083-85;"11061-64; 11023-26:10977-80. 10641-437 10522-32;710348-56;
9460-70 ~ 0.38 228 Open

28. Acid Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc (continued)

Depth Interval Amount and Type of Material

, Frac w/ 108,4284# total sd in perfs (w/ 11,4284 20-40 Optiprop, and 57,500 20-40 Versaprop) and 12,500# .
12748 - 12753 Versaprop in csg

11604 - 11788 ~ Hybrid frac well w/ 2957 bbls of YF and WF122 gel and 125,750# of 20/40 Opti-Prop sand *

11262 - 11366~ Hybrid frac stage 3 w/ 2292 bbls of YF and WF115 gel and 91,100 # of 20/40 Opti Prop sand ~

10977 - 11138 7 Hybrid frac stage 4 w/ 120980# 20-40 Optiprop, using 2818 bbls WF and YF 115 gel ~

10522 10643~ Frac well w/ 1785 bbls on YF120 and 118 gel and 61,765# of 20/40 OptiProp sand ~

9460 - 9470 7 Frac well w/ 1907 bbls of YF120 and 118 gel and 66,596# of 20/40 SB Excel sand ”




Form 3160- S UNITED STATES
{Apnil 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM APPROVED
OMB No 1004- 0137
Expires March 31, 2007

5. Lease Seral No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-75083
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6 If Indian. Allottee. or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. FUnitor CA A“’*“}‘j'}:“““’e and/er No

1 Type of Well

I:]Od Well Gas Welt D()!hcl

8. Well Name and No

2 Name of Operator
Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge Federal 24-20-10-17
9. APl Well No

43-013-33081

10 Field and Pool. or Exploratory Area

3a Address 3b. Phone No_ (mclude area code)
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044
4 Location of Well tl-ootage. S TR .M. or Survey Description)

491 FSL & 1789 FWI. SE SW

Eight Mile Flat

11 County or Panish, State

Duchesne County, Utah

12, CHECK APPROPRIATL BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTHER DATA

TYPLE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OFF ACTION

I:]anlcc of Intent DAuduc I:lDeepen I:Il’roduction
Suhsequenl Report D(‘asinp Repan DNew Construction I:lRecomplel

{ Stan’ Resume) DWnlur Shut-olt

I:IAhenng Castng Dl:raclure Treat I:IReclamzmon I:IWeII Integnty

e ()lher Site Secunty

I::I(‘hungc Plans DPlug and abandon D’I'cmpomrily Abandon diagram - submitial
Dl’inai Abandonment Notice D(’onvcn to Injection DPlug back DWaler Disposal

13 Desenbe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertient details, including estimated starting date ol any proposed work and approximale duration thereo!
It the proposal is 1o deepen directionally or recomplete honzontally | give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones

Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed o provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. R
following completion of the involved operations  If' the operation results in a multiple completion or recomplet

equired subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
on ma new interval. a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once

tesing has been completed - Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only afler all requirements. including reclamation. have been completed. and the operator has

determined that the site is ready for final inspection

Please find attached a copy of the site security diagram for this well.

Ao : i“}»./ e
Lo Dbl inn of

{ias and Mining

FOH HECOHD ORLY

RECEIVED
AUG 038 2007

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

141 hereby certify that the foregoing s true and correct

Name t/'roned Typed)
Tile
Beverly Walker Enginecring Technician
Signature - . ./ Date
N A i A August 2, 2007
7 / THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE
Approved by Title Date

Condinons of approval. if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant o]
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title 10 those nghts 1 the subject lease|Office
which  would  enttle  the  apphcant 1o conduct _ operations thereon,

Title 18 USC Section 1005 AND Title 43 1JSC Section 1212. make 1t a cnme for any person knowingly and willfully 10 make any department or agency of the United

States any lalse, fictitiousor fraudulent statements of representations as o any matter within its junsdiction

(Instructions on puge 2)



~
Separator/Dehy
Sales Combination Unit
Line |} [T
A o o POSITION OF VALVES AND USE OF SEALS DURING PRODUCTION/BLOWDOWN|
Vaives Line Purpose Position Seal Installed
D Drain Closed Yes
S Sales Closed Yes
| Inlet Open No
meter __ 0 | _Oveflow | OpeniClosed |  No
B Blowdown Open/Closed No
POSITION OF VALVES AND USE OF SEALS DURING SALES
_ Valves Line Purpose Position | Seal Installed
D e Drain o Closed - Yes
S Sales - Open No
| Inlet o VClosed Yes
(o] Overflow ~ Closed Yes
B Blowdown Closed Yes
— _ POSITION OF VALVES AND USE OF SEALS DURING WATER DRAIN
D A I R D T i hes
. % T T Valves Line Purpose Position Seal Installed
%[ Berm 48'X33'X1.5' b [0} Drain_ | Open No
i3 Sales Closed Yes
1 Inlet | Closed No
o wt ) o Overflow ) ] Closedr ~ No
2 s N B Blowdown Closed No
[
bbl 3 This lease is subject to the
> 300 Site Securily Plan for GASCO v
- W/T N L Production Company. The es valve
] . N Plan is located at D - Drain Valve
\ I \ an s locatec at: 1 - Inlet Vaive
i ] GASCO Production Company
. X O - Overflow
- i ! 8 Invemess Drive East
i } N B - Blowdown
- L ! X Suite 100 V - Vent
(o) [6) : o Englewood, CO 80112-5625
- 3
7 ¢ g !
< ! L | Lease #
iP5 UTU-75083
o !
1 |
)
Q@
] > i
[ I
;] O i
| i
| i
] |
1 )

N

OO0

355 gal, 1. rock oil 2
unmarked 3. dinl

BUYS & ASSOCIATES, INC.
ENVIRONMENTAL CONSULTANTS

Gasco Production Company

WRF 24-20-10-17

SE/SW Sec. 20 Twp. 10S Rge. 17E
Duchesne County, Utah

June 2007
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United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

TAKE PRIDE
INAMERICA

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
UT-922

May 30, 2008

Gasco Energy, Inc.

Attn: Cathy Greway 4 3 -0/3-320 8/

8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100
Englewood, Colorado 80112

Re: Initial Mesaverde Formation PA "B"
Wilkin Ridge (Deep) Unit
Duchesne and Uintah Counties, Utah

Gentlemen:

The Initial Mesaverde Formation Participating Area “B”, Wilkin Ridge (Deep) Unit, UTU81153B, is
hereby approved effective as of January 6, 2007, pursuant to Section 11 of the Wilkin Ridge (Deep)
Unit Agreement, Duchesne and Uintah Counties, Utah.

The Initial Mesaverde Formation Participating Area “B” results in an Initial Participating Area of
160.00 acres and is based upon the completion of Well No. 24-20-10-17, API No. 43-013-33081, in
the SE% SW of Section 20, Township 10 South, Range 17 East, SLM&B, Federal Unit Tract No.
21, Lease No. UTU75083, as being a well capable of producing unitized substances in paying

quantities. Same ents 7 Y I"émains

Copies of the approved request are being distributed to the appropriate agencies and one copy is
returned herewith. Please advise all interested parties of the establishment of the Initial Mesaverde
Formation Participating Area “B”, Wilkin Ridge (Deep) Unit, and the effective date.

Sincerely,
/s/ Becky J. Hammond

Becky J. Hammond
Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure

JUN 0 % 2008

T,
Gy, OF AL, CAS & WMINING



API Well No: 43013330810000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-75083

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WILKIN RIDGE DEEP

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43013330810000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
EIGHT MILE FLAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:

0491 FSL 1789 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: SESW Section: 20 Township: 10.0S Range: 17.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
DUCHESNE

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
!/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [} cHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [] cHANGE TuBING [} cHANGE WELL NAME
1/7/2011
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
[] SUBSEQUENT REPORT [ peepen [J FRACTURE TREAT [] NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE !/ WATER DISPOSAL
[] DRILLING REPORT [0 waTER sHuTOFF [0 s1TA sTATUS EXTENSION [0 app ExTENsION
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER:

state approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 30, 2 south

to the currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose of
water from this well.

Range 4 west in North Blue Bench UT. This facility would be used in addition

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Gasco would like to dispose of water at Integrated Water management, LLC

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

Date:__ 12/30/2010

By: L.

)

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Roger Knight 303 996-1803 EHS Supervisor
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 12/29/2010

RECEIVED December 29, 2010




Division of Qil, Gas and Mining

Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 4/16/2015

FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERATOR:

Gasco Prodcution Company N2575 Badlands Production Company N4265

7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500 7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500

Denver, CO 80237 Denver, CO 80237

303-996-1805 303-996-1805

CA Number(s): Unit(s):Gate Canyon, Wilkin Ridge Deep, RBU-EOR-GRRV
WELL INFORMATION:

Well Name Sec [TWN [RNG [API Entity Mineral |Surface |[Type Status
See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION:

1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2015
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2015
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 1454161-0143

REVIEW:

1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 6/2/2015
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: N/A

3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/3/2015

4. OPS/SI/TA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 1/20/2016

5. UICS on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: N/A

6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: None

7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): N/A
NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:

1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: SUR0027842

2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A

3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): SUR0027845

DATA ENTRY:

1. Well(s) update in the OGIS on:

2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on:

3. Unit(s) operator number update in OGIS on:

4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on:

5. State/Fee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on:
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on:

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:

SUR0035619 -FCB

1/22/2016
1/22/2016
1/22/2016
N/A
1/22/2016
N/A

1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 1/22/2016

COMMENTS:

1/22/2016



From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

Well Name Section |TWN |RNG |API Number |Entity |Mineral |Surface |Type |Status
FEDERAL 23-18G-9-19 18 090S | 190E 4304752496 Federal Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 14-17G-9-19 17 090S |190E |4304752522 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 13-18G-9-19 18 090S |190E 4304752538 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 23-29G-9-19 29 090S |190E |4304752544 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 24-20G-9-19 20 090S |190E 4304752545 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 31-21G-9-19 21 090S |190E 4304752546 Federal |Federal OW |APD
Federal 323-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753026 Federal Federal GW |APD
Federal 421-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753027 Federal |Federal | GW |APD
Federal 322-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753029 Federal |Federal GW |APD
Federal 431-29-9-19 29 090S |190E [4304753030 | Federal |Federal GW |APD
Federal 432-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753031 | Federal Federal GW |APD
Federal 414-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753070 Federal |Federal GW |APD
FEDERAL 412-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753073 Federal |Federal GW |APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753076 Federal |Federal | GW |APD
federal 321-29-9-19 29 090S |190E|4304753078 Federal |Federal (GW |APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S | 190E 4304753079 Federal |Federal GW |APD
FEDERAL 321-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753080 Federal |Federal GW |APD
Federal 212-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753133 Federal |Federal GW |APD
State 321-32-9-19 32 090S |190E |4304754479 State State |GW_|APD
State 423-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754480 State State |GW |APD
State 421-32-9-19 32 090S |190E |4304754481 State State |GW_|APD
State 413-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754482 State State |GW |APD
State 323-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754483 State State |GW |APD
State 431-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754529 State State |GW |APD
Desert Spring State 224-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304754541 State State |GW |APD
Desert Spring State 243-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304754542 State State |GW |APD
Desert Spring State 241-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304754543 State State |GW APD
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304753012 |19650 Federal |Federal | GW |DRL
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 100S |170E 4301333098 (15941 |Federal |Federal (GW |OPS
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 090S |190E 4304736915 {16556 |Fee Fee GW _|OPS
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S |180E 4304738573 17201 |Federal Federal |(GW |OPS
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304739777 |18344 |[Federal Federal GW |OPS
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S |190E 4304739800 [17202 |Federal Federal GW |OPS
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 110S |150E 4301332391 13787 |State State |GW [P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 100S |170E 4301332447 114033 |State State |GW_|P
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 110S |150E 4301332475 |14417 State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 100S |170E 4301332560 [14726 |Federal |Federal | GW |P
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 110S |160E 4301332611 14439 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332619 15649 |State State |GW [P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 124-11-17 4 110S |170E|4301332674 |15537 |Federal |Federal GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 100S |170E|4301332676 |15242 |State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 100S |170E 4301332679 14033 |[Federal |Federal  GW |P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 16 110S |150E 4301332685 [16082 State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 100S |170E 4301332730 |15243 |State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 100S |170E 4301332773 |15370 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 8 110S [170E 4301332778 14802 Federal |Federal | GW [P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 1110S |160E 4301332888 15098 |State State |GW P
|WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 100S [170E|4301333081 |15714 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 100S |170E 4301333087 ;15807 [Federal |Federal \GW |P
|WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 110S [170E|4301333099 ;15920 Federal |[Federal GW [P
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 110S |140E 4301333437 |16919 Federal |Federal | GW |P
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 i 24 110S !140E 4301333443 /16367 Federal [Federal GW |P
SQUAW CROSSING U 5 2 100S |180E 4304730129 16266 |State State |OW [P
RBU 5-11D 11 100S |180E 4304730409 9005 |Federal Federal OW P |
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 090S | 180E 4304730624 (9030 |Federal |Federal |OW |P




From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU 6-2D 2 100S [180E 4304731190 |7075 |State |State |OW |P
NGC 33-18J 18 090S |190E 4304731200 |6155 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
RBU 13-2D 2 100S |180E 4304731280 |16267 |State  |State |OW |P
RBU 16-3D 3 100S |180E 4304731352 |16268 [Federal |Federal OW |P
RBU 10-11D 11 100S |180E 4304731357 |7053 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
RBU 8-10D 10 100S |180E 4304731364 (4955 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
RBU 15-3D 3 100S |180E 4304731539 |9965 |Federal |Federal OW |P
RBU 12-12D 12 100S [180E 4304731651 |10688 |Federal |Federal OW |P
RBU 2-10D 10 100S |180E[4304731801 {10784 |Federal |Federal | OW |P
RBU 3-15D 15 100S |180E [4304733600 |13213 [Federal |Federal  OW |P
RBU 3-12D 12 100S |180E [4304733739 |14492 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
STATE 7-36A 36 090S |180E|4304733741 14244 State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 34-29 29 090S |190E|4304733750 |13174 Federal Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 100S |180E 4304733983 |13182 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 090S |[190E|4304734111 113441 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 24-20-9-19 20 090S |190E 4304734168 |14150 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FED 44-20-9-19 20 090S | 190E 4304734169 |14140 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S |190E 4304734199 |13601 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304734201 |13641 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 42-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304734202 |13455 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 100S |170E [4304734286 |13492 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
STATE 4-32B 32 090S |190E[4304734314 |14440 State  |State |GW |P
FED 14-18-2 #1 18 100S | 180E 4304734539 13491 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 100S |170E |4304734551 |13726 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 090S |190E 4304734607 113640 Federal |Federal |GW [P
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S |190E 14304734608 [14151 Federal |Federal (GW |P
FED 22-30-10-18 30 100S |180E 4304734924 [14280 [Federal |Federal (GW |P
FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304735343 14202 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 11-22-9-19 22 090S |190E|4304735404 [14203 Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 42-21-9-19 21 090S |190E[4304735405 {14928 |Federal |Federal GW |P
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 090S |190E[4304735588 |14418 |State | Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S |190E 4304735606 |14441 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 090S |190E|4304735614 |14442 Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 090S |190E (4304735623 114640 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304735624 14419 |Federal |Federal [GW |P
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 090S |190E|4304735732 14496 |Fee Fee |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 090S |190E|4304735733 14519 |Fee Fee |GW |P
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 100S |180E 4304735808 |15592 |[Federal Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 100S |190E 4304735844 14356 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304735845 |14639 |State  |State |GW |P
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 090S |190E|4304735995 |14871 State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S |190E 4304736093 |14976 |Federal |Federal |(GW |P
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S |190E[4304736094 [16120 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304736095 |14872 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 090S |180E 4304736113 |15096 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304736219 |14738 |State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304736220 (14763 State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304736233 |14764 State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304736241 |14992 [State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S |180E (4304736242 |14716 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 090S |190E|4304736271 15884 Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304736336 |15086 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304736368 |15605 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304736442 |15715 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304736600 14977 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304736719 |15186 Federal Federal | GW |P




From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company

Effective Date: 4/16/2015

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 125 090S |180E 4304736727 !15475 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304736739 |15476 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304736740 |15213 |Federal |Federal [GW |P
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S |190E|4304736771 |15355 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 090S | 180E 4304736772 |15338 [Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 30 090S ' 190E (4304736817 15212 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 090S |190F 4304736913 |15187 |Fee Fee |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 090S |190E 4304736916 (17012 |Fee Fee |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304737115 |15011 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 090S |190E (4304737116 |16163 Federal |Federal (GW |P
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 090S 190F 4304737117 |16275 |Federal [Federal |GW [P
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180F 4304737132 |15087 |State  |State |GW [P
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S |180F 4304737338 15365 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304737611 [16311 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S |190F 4304737612 16051 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304737613 (16052 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S (190E 4304737621 |16253 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S |190F [4304737622 |16264 Federal Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304737630 |16557 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S |180F 4304737631 15961 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S |180F 4304737646 16023 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S '180F |4304737647 16121 |Federal [Federal GW |P
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S |180E 4304737676 16254 State  |State |GW P
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 100S |180F 4304737677 |15806 |State  |State |GW |P
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S |180E 4304738028 |16868 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S | 190F |4304738336 (16467 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 090S |190F [4304738337 16119 |[Federal |Federal GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S |180E 4304738351 |16884 |Federal [Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304738352 |16349 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S |180F 4304738353 16210 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S | 190F |4304738407 16236 |Federal |Federal GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 090S |180F 4304738465 16558 |[Federal |Federal GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304738469 |16449 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S |190E |4304738575 |16312 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S | 190F |4304738673 115832 |Fee Fee |GW [P
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 11 100S |180E 4304738896 16792 Federal |Federal GW P
STATE 21-32B 32 090S |190E 4304739170 |16309 |State  |State |GW |P
STATE 22-32A 32 090S '190E 4304739171 /16308 [State  |State |GW |P
STATE 21-32A 32 090S '190F [4304739172 [16310 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S |190F [4304739717 |17054 Federal |[Federal |GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304739729 |17241 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304739730 (17266 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 1 100S |180E |4304739773 (17013 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S |190E 4304740233 |17014 |[Federal Federal |GW [P
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S |190E 14304751280 |18211 |Federal |Federal | OW |P
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304751281 |18210 |[Federal |Federal | OW |P
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190 4304752870 {19647 |[Federal |Federal GW |P
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S |190F 4304752872 |19648 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19 ] 30 090S |190E 4304753011 |19649 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S |180F (4304753324 [19783 |State  |State |GW |P
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S |180F 4304753325 |19783 |State  |State |GW |P
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S |180F |4304753326 19747 |State  |State |GW |P
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304753327 |19747 |State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S |180F 4304753328 '19783 [State  |State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S '170E[4301332677 |15144 |State  |State |GW S
RBU 4-11D 11 100S |180E 14304730718 |16269 |Federal |Federal (OW [S




From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU 2-11D 11 100S |180E |4304730826 116270 |[Federal |Federal OW |S
RBU 6-11D 11 100S |180E 4304731192 16271 |Federal |Federal OW |S
STATE 2-32B 32 090S |190E 4304732221 |11371 State  |State |GW_|S
STATE 9-36A 36 090S |180E |4304732225 |11364 |State  |State |GW |S
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S |190E 4304733581 |13249 |Federal |Federal |GW |S
STATE 13-36A 36 090S |180E|4304733598 17838 |State  |State |GW |S
FEDERAL 16-26A - 26 090S |180E 4304733601 |12928 |Federal 'Federal | GW |S
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S |190E 4304733653 13077 |[Federal Federal (GW |S
RBU 1-10D 10 100S |180E|4304734312 [16265 |[Federal |Federal OW 'S
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S |190E 4304739776 (17149 Federal |Federal GW |S




STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU-76482

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

®. IFINDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WEL
Y owwew [J

GAS WELL OTHER

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

Desert Spring Fed 21-1-10-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:

9. API NUMBER:

Gasco Production Company 4304737631
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10, FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDGAT-
7979 E. Tufts Ave. crry Denver s1are CO 580237 (303) 483-0044 Uteland Butte
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FooTAGES AT sURFAce: 0633 FNL 1512 FWL county: Uintah

QTR/AQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 1 108 18E S STATE: y

TAH
. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION _ TYPE OF ACTION
[ aciize [J oeeren [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

2] nNoTiCE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) [ Arercasing

Approximate date work will start [[] casingrepar

4/16/2015

[] crance TueinG

[] suBseQUENTREPORT  |[T] cHaNce weLL NAME

(Submit Originat Form Only)

Date of work completion:

[C] converT weLL Type

[ cHance To PREVIOUS PLANS

[] cHance weLL sTaTUS
[C] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS

[[] eracture TrReAT

[C] ~ewconsTRucTION

[/] oPeraTOR CHaNGE

[ Puucanp ABanDON

[ ruseack

[] ProDUCTION (STARTRESUME)

[J RecLAMATION OF WELL SITE

[C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

[[] sibETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
[J TeEmPORARILY ABANDON
] rtueinc Repair

[J venrorFLare

[ warter bisposaL

] waTER sHuT-OFF

1 omer:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco Production Company requests a change of operator on this well, in addition to the wells on the attached list from Gasco
Production Company to Badlands Production Company, effective date of 4/16/2015.

Gasco Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite 11
Denver CO 80237

303-996-1805 M i

Michael Decker, Exec. Vice President & COO

Badlands Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite,115
Denver CO 80237
303-996-1805 -

Michael Decker, Exec. Vicd President & COO

RECEIVED
JUN 02 2015

DIV, QF OIL, GAS & MINING

APPROVED

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) LjLndsey C°°ks rme Engineering Tech
SIGNATURE ‘ ( ﬁl@/ oate 9/18/2015
(This space for State use only)
JAN 2 2 2016
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

| V. OlL GAS & MINING -
BYWM\&



Well Name

FEDERAL 332-30-9-19

WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19

FEDERAL 12-17-9-19

GATE CYN 31-21-11-15

WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15

WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16

WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-11-17
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08

GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17
RYE PATCH FED 22-21

RYE PATCH FED 24-21

RBU 5-11D

FEDERAL 7-25A

RBU 6-2D

NGC 33-18)

RBU 13-2D

RBU 16-3D

RBU 10-11D

RBU 8-10D

RBU 15-3D

RBU 12-12D

RBU 2-10D

RBU 3-15D

RBU 3-12D

STATE 7-36A

FEDERAL 34-29
FEDERAL 24-7 #1

FEDERAL 23-29 #1

FED 24-20-9-19

FED 44-20-9-19

FED 23-21-9-19

FED 32-31-9-19

FED 42-29-9-19

PETES WASH 23-12 #1

STATE 4-32B

FED 14-18-2 #1

FED 43-24-3 #1

LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19

FED 11-21-9-19

FED 22-30-10-18

FEDERAL 43-30-9-19

FED 11-22-9-19

FED 42-21-9-19

STATE 24-16-9-19

Section TWN
30 090S
29 1008
23 0908
26 0908
19 090S
17 090S
21 1108
32 1008
20 1108
17 1008
19 1108
32 1008
4 1108
32 1008
29 1008
16 1108
16 1008
29 1008
8 1108
16 1108
20 1008
20 1008
4 1108
22 1108
24 1108
11 1008
25 0908
2 1008
18 090S
2 1008
3 1008
11 1008
10 100S
3 1008
12 100S
10 1008
15 1008
12 1008
36 090S
29 0908
7 1008
29 090S
20 090S
20 090S
21 090S
31 090S
29 090S
12 1008
32 090S
18 1008
24 1008
22 0908
21 0908
30 1008
30 090S
22 090S
21 090S
16 090s

RNG
190E
170E
190E
180E
190E
190E
1S0E
170E
150E
170E
160E
170E
170E
170E
170E
150E
170E
170E
170E
160E
170E
170E
170E
140E
140E
180E
180E
180E
190E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
170E
190E
180E
170E
190E
190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E

API

4304753012
4301333098
4304736915
4304738573
4304739777
4304739800
4301332391
4301332447
4301332475
4301332560
4301332611
4301332619
4301332674
4301332676
4301332679
4301332685
4301332730
4301332773
4301332778
4301332888
4301333081
4301333087
4301333099
4301333437
4301333443
4304730409
4304730624
4304731190
4304731200
4304731280
4304731352
4304731357
4304731364
4304731539
4304731651
4304731801
4304733600
4304733739
4304733741
4304733750
4304733983
4304734111
4304734168
4304734169
4304734199
4304734201
4304734202
4304734286
4304734314
4304734539
4304734551
4304734607
4304734608
4304734924
4304735343
4304735404
4304735405
4304735588

Entity
19650
15941
16556
17201
18344
17202
13787
14033
14417
14726
14439
15649
15537
15242
14033
16082
15243
15370
14802
15098
15714
15807
15920
16919
16367
9005

9030

7075

6155

16267
16268
7053

4955

9965

10688
10784
13213
14492
14244
13174
13182
13441
14150
14140
13601
13641
13455
13492
14440
13491
13726
13640
14151
14280
14202
14203
14928
14418

Mineral
Federal
Federal
Fee
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
State
Federal
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State

Surface Type

Federal
Federal
Fee
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
State
Federal
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal

Federal
State

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal

GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
GwW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW

Status

335532
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FEDERAL 31-21-9-19
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19

LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19

DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18
STATE 12-32-9-19

FEDERAL 12-20-9-19
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19

LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19

DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18

FEDERAL 12-1-10-18

SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19
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14
22

36
32
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36
31
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31
31
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14
36

1008
1008
090S
090S

090S
090S
0908
1008
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100S
100S
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0908
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190E
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180E
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4304735606
4304735614
4304735623
4304735624
4304735732
4304735733
4304735808
4304735844
4304735845
4304735995
4304736093
4304736094
4304736095
4304736113
4304736219
4304736220
4304736233
4304736241
4304736242
4304736271
4304736336
4304736368
4304736442
4304736600
4304736719
4304736727
4304736739
4304736740
4304736771
4304736772
4304736817
4304736913
4304736916
4304737115
4304737116
4304737117
4304737132
4304737338
4304737611
4304737612
4304737613
4304737621
4304737622
4304737630
4304737631
4304737646
4304737647
4304737676
4304737677
4304738028
4304738336
4304738337
4304738351
4304738352
4304738353
4304738407
4304738465
4304738469
4304738575

14441
14442
14640
14419
14496
14519
15592
14356
14639
14871
14976
16120
14872
15096
14738
14763
14764
14992
14716
15884
15086
15605
15715
14977
15186
15475
15476
15213
15355
15338
15212
15187
17012
15011
16163
16275
15087
15365
16311
16051
16052
16253
16264
16557
15961
16023
16121
16254
15806
16868
16467
16119
16884
16349
16210
16236
16558
16449
16312

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Fee
Fee
Federal
Federal
State
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Federal
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Federal
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LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18
STATE 21-32B

STATE 22-32A

STATE 21-32A

FEDERAL 11-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID)
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19

Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18

22
11
32
32
32
19
25
25
I

19
30
19
30
30
30
36
36
36
36

DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36

WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17
SQUAW CROSSING U §
RBU 4-11D

RBU 2-11D

RBU 6-11D

STATE 2-32B

STATE 9-36A
FEDERAL 13-30B
STATE 13-36A
FEDERAL 16-26A
FEDERAL 31-29

RBU 1-10D

FEDERAL 13-18-9-19

32
2

11
11
11
32
36
30
36
26
29
10
18

090S
100S
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090S
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100S
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090S
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4304738673
4304738896
4304739170
4304739171
4304739172
4304739717
4304739729
4304739730
4304739773
4304740233
4304751280
4304751281
4304752870
4304752872
4304753011
4304753324
4304753325
4304753326
4304753327
4304753328
4301332677
4304730129
4304730718
4304730826
4304731192
4304732221
4304732225
4304733581
4304733598
4304733601
4304733653
4304734312
4304739776

15832
16792
16309
16308
16310
17054
17241
17266
17013
17014
18211
18210
19647
10648
19649
19783
19783
19747
19747
19783
15144
16266
16269
16270
16271
11371
11364
13249
17838
12928
13077
16265
17149

Fee
Federal
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
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