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EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY
T2S, R4W, U.S.B.&M. Well location, BROTHERSON#2-2484, located as

shown in the NW 1/4 SW 1/4 of Section 24,T2S, R4W, U.S.B.&M. Duchsene County, Utah.
WEST- 5280.00' (G.L.O.) BASIS OF ELEVATION

taas Alum, cap SPOL ELEVATIONLOCATED AT THE SOUTHWEST CORNER OF1.0' High, Set Stone
SECTION 24, T2S, R4W, U.S.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE
ALTAMONTQUADRANGLE,UTAH, DUCHESNE COUNTY, 7.5
MINUTESERIES (TOPOGRAPHICAL MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE

4 3 UNITED STATES DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICALSURVEY. SAID ELEVATIONIS MARKED AS BEING 6242 FEET.WW
BASIS OF BEARINGS

BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.

N

24
o

°o

o

SCALEBROTHERSON/2-2484
CERTlIRGA

ISV. Ungraded Ground = 6209' Tsis is To CERTIFYTHAT ..PLA ED FROM
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUALS MADE BY ME MY
SUPERVISIONAND THAT ARE CT TO THEBEST OF MYKNOWLEDGEANO31(E

Set Stone, Steel
-.......-Post UnvrAu ENGINEERING & M SURVEYINGtas2Aium cp N8954'02"W- 2657.90'(Meas.)

" N89°52'W
- 2634.72' (G.L.O.) 85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL UTAH 84078High, Steel

(435) 789-1017(AUTONOMOUSNAD 83)LEGEND: LATITUDE= 40°1723.85" (40.289958) SCALE1"
= 1000' 9

27-n0 OD-
04=

90° SYMBOL LONGITUDE= 110°1726.39 (110.290664) PARTY REFERENCES(AUTONOMOUSNAD 27) D.A. B.B. D.R.B. G.L.O. PLATO = PRoPOSED WELL HEAD· LATlTUDE= 40°1724.01" (40.290003) WEATHER FILEA = SECTION CORNERSLOCATED. LONGITUDE= 110'1723.83' (110.289953) wARM EL PASO PRODUCTIONOIL & GAS
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BROTHERSON 2-24 B4

NWISW Sec. 24, T2S, R4W
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

LEASE NUMBER: FEE

ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1
EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY

DRILLINGPROGRAM

1. Estimated Tops of Important Geologic Markers:

Formation Depth

Green River 5,050
Mahogany Bench 7,225'
L. Green River 8,550'
Wasatch 10,325'
TO 12,750'

2. Estimated Depths of Anticipated Water, Oil, Gas, or Mineral Formations:

Substance Formation Depth

Green River 5,050'
Mahogany Bench 7,225'

Oil L. Green River 8,550'
Oil Wasatch 10,325'

3. Pressure Control Equipment: (Schematic Attached)

The BOP stack will consist of one 11" 5,000 psi annular BOP 11" 5,000 psi double ram,
and one 1l' drilling spool. The lower ram will contain pipe rams, and the upperram will
contain blind rams.

The choke and kill lines and the choke manifold will have a 5,000 psi minimum pressure.

The BOPE and related equipment will meet the requirements of the 5M system.

4. Proposed Casing & Cementing Program:

Please refer to the attached Casing and Cementing
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5. Drilling Fluids Program:

Please refer to the attached Mud Program.

6. Evaluation Program:

Please refer to the attached Logging Program.

7. Abnormal Conditions

Maximum anticipated bottomhole pressure calculated @12,750' TD, approximately
equals 6,298 psi (calculated at 0.494 psi/foot).

Maximum anticipated surface pressure equals approximately 3,493 psi (bottomhole
pressure minus the pressure of a partially evacuated hole calculated at 0.22
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BROTHERSON 2-24 B4

NWISW Sec. 24, T2S, R4W
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

LEASE NUMBER: FEE

ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1

MULTI-POINTSURFACE USE & OPERATIONSPLAN

1. Existing Roads:

To reach the proposed location: Refer to the attached Location Directions.

Refer to Topo Maps A and B for location of access roads within a 2-mile radius.

All existing roads will be maintained and kept in good repair during all drilling and
completion operationsassociated with this well.

2. Planned Access Roads:

Approximately 0.3 miles of access road is proposed. Refer to Topo Map B.

Surfàce disturbanceand vehicular traffic will be limited to the approved location and
approved access route. Any additional area needed will be approved in advance.

3. Location of Existing Wells Within a 1-Mile Radius:

Refer to Topo Map C.

4. Loçation of Existing & Proposed Facilities:

Thefollowingguidelines will apply if the well is productive.

All production facilities will be located on the disturbed portion of the well pad and at a
minimum of 25 feet from the toe of the back slope or the top of the fill slope. As
determined by the onsite inspection.

A dike will be constructed completely around those production facilities which contain
fluids (i.e., production tanks, produced water tanks, and/or heater/treater). These dikes
will be constructed of compacted subsoil, be impervious, hold I 10% of the capacity of
the largest tank, and be independent of the back cut. As determined by the onsite
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All permanent (on-site six months or longer) above the ground structures constructed or
installed, including pumping units, will be painted a flat, non-reflective, Juniper Green
color to match one of the standard environmental colors, as determined by the actingAO
during the onsite inspection.

All flicilities will be painted within six months of installation. Facilities required to
comply with the Occupational Safety and Health Act (OSHA) will be excluded.

Any necessary pits will be properly fenced to protect livestock and prevent wildlife entry.

In the event that oil and gas production is established, the pipeline connection(s) and
lateral(s) shall tie in to the existing pipeline The proposed pipeline will leave the well
pad in a Northwesterly direction for an approximate distance of 1,791'. Refer to Topo
Map D.

All buried pipelines will be buried to a depth of 3 feet, except at road crossings where
they will be buried to a depth of 4 feet.

Construction width of the right-of-way/pipeline route shall be restricted to 50 feet of
disturbance.

5. Location and Tyne of Water Sunalv:

Water to be used for the drilling of the proposed well will obtained from Dalbo Inc.'s
underground well, located in Ouray, Utah, Sec, 32, T4S, R3E, Water User Claim
#43-8496,Application #53617.

6. Source of Construction Materials:

Surface and subsoil materials in the immediate area will be utilized.

Any gravel will be obtained from a commercial source.

7. Methods of Handling Waste Materials:

Drill cuttings will be contained and buried in the reserve pit.

Drilling fluids, including salts and chemicals, will be contained in the reserve pit. Upon
termination of drilling andcompletion operations, the liquid contents of the reserve pit
will be removed and disposed of at an approved waste disposalfacility within 120 days
after drilling is terminated.

The reserve pit will be constructed on the location and will not be located within natural
drainage, where a flood hazard exists or surface runoff will destroy or damage the pit
walls. The reserve pit will be constructed so that it will not leak, break, or allow
discharge of
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A plastic reinforced liner shall be used. The liner will be a minimum of 12 mil thick,
with sufficient bedding used to cover any rocks. The liner will overlap the pit walls and
be covered with dirt and/or rocks to hold it in place. No trash or scrap that could
puncture the liner will be disposed of in the pit. As determined during the onsite
inspection.

Any spills of oil, gas, salt water, or other noxious fluids will be immediately cleaned up
and removed to an approveddisposal site.

A chemical porta-toilet will be furnished with the drilling rig.

Garbage, trash, and other waste materials will be collected in a portable, self-contained,
fully enclosed trash cage during operations. No trash will be burned on location.

All debris and other waste material not contained in the trash cage will be cleaned up and
removed from the location immediately after removal of the drilling rig.

Any open pits will be fenced during the operations. The fencing will be maintaineduntil
such time as the pits are backfilled.

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA Title III (hazardous materials) in an
amount greater than 10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored, transported, or
disposed of annually in association with the drilling of this well. Furthermore, no
extremely hazardous substances, as defmed in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning
quantities, will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association with
the drilling of this well.

Any produced water from the proposed well will be contained in a water tankand a line
installed that will tie into the existing SWD line ( Ute 2-33C6, Sec. 33, T3S, R6W, and
the Cedar Rim 15, Sec. 34, T3S, R6W). The produced water will then be disposed of at
the Ute #1 Disposal, Sec. 15, T3S, R6W, via the SWD line. This request is in lieu of
filing Form 3160-5, after initial production.

8. Ancillary Facilities:

None are anticipated.

9. Well Site Layout: (SeeLocation Layout Diagram)

The attached Location Layout Diagram describes drill pad cross-sections, cuts and fills,
and locations of the mud tanks, reserve pit, flare pit, pipe racks, trailer parking, spoil dirt
stockpile(s), and surface material stockpile(s).

Please see the attached diagram to describe rig orientation, parking areas, and access
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The reserve pit will be lined, and when the reserve pit is closed, the pit liner will be
buried below plow depth. As determined during the omite inspection.

All pits will be fenced according to the following minimum standards:

39 inch net wire will be used with at least one strand of barbed wire on top of the net
wire. Barbed wire is not necessary if pipe or some type of reinforcement rod is attached
to the top of the entire fence.

The net wire shall be no more than two inches above the ground. The barbed wire shall
be three inches over the net wire, Total height of the fence shall be at least 42 inches.

Corner posts shall be cemented and/or braced in such a manner to keep the fence tight at
all times.

Corners shall be rounded as needed in order to control drainage.

Standard steel, wood, or pipe posts shallbe used between the corner braces. Maximum
distance between any 2 fence posts shall be no greater than 16 feet.

All wire shall be stretched, by using a stretching device before it is attached to corner
posts.

The reserve pit fencing will be on three sides during drilling operations, and on the fourth
side when the rig moves off location. Pits will be fenced and maintained until cleanup.

10. Plans for Reclamation of the Surface:

Producing Location:

Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area will be cleared of
all unused tubing, materials, trash, and debris not required for production.

Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons in the pit shall be removed in
accordance with R649-3-16.

A plastic, nylon reinforced liner with felt shall be used, it shall be torn and perforated
before backfdling of the reserve pit.

Before any dirt work associated with location restoration takesplace, the reserve pit shall
be as dry as possible. All debris in it will be removed. Other waste and spoil materials
will be disposed of immediately upon completion of operations.

The reserve pit and that portion of the location not needed for production
facilities/operations will be recontoured to the approximate natural
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The reserve pit will be reclaimed within 90 days from the date of well completion,
weather permitting.

To prevent surfàce water(s) from standing (ponding) on the reclaimed reserve pit area,
final reclamation of the reserve pit will consist of"mounding" the surface three feet
above surrounding ground surface to allow the reclaimed pit area to drain effectively.

The pit topsoil shall be piled as shown on the Location Layout diagram.

Upon completion of backfilling, leveling, and recontouring, the stockpiled topsoil will be
spread evenly over the reclaimed ares(s). Asdetermined during the onsite inyection.

Dry Hole/Abandoned Location:

Abandoned well sites, roads, and other disturbedareas will be restored as near as
practical to their original condition. Where applicable, these conditions include the re-

establishment of irrigation systems,the re-establishment of appropriate soil conditions,
and re-establishment of vegetation as specified.

All disturbed surfaces will be recontoured to the approximate natural contours, with
reclamation of the well pad and access road to be performed as soon as practical after
final abandonment. Reseeding operationswill be performed after completion of other
reclamation operations,

11. SurfaceOwnership:

The wellsite and lease is located entirely on Private Surface. A hard copy of the Surface
Owner Agreement is attached.

William N. Brotherson et ut
Lake Fork Ranch Inc. by Brent Brotherson, President
HC 65 Box 510048
Mountain Home, UT 84051-9801

12. Other Information:

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made with all applicable laws, regulations, the approved Plan of Operations, and any
applicable Notice of Lessees. The Operator is fully responsible for the actions of his
contractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished to the field representative to
ensure compliance.

The Operator will control noxious weeds along Rights-of-Way for roads, pipelines, well
sites, or other applicable
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The Cultural Resource Survey Report has been waived by the Surface Owner. A hard
copy of the waiver is attached,

13, Lessee's or Operator's Representative & Certification:

Cheryl Cameron Scott Palmer
Authorized Agent for Drilling Manager
El Paso Production O&G Co. El Paso Production O&G Co.
I139 El Segundo NE 9 GreenwayPlaza
Albuquerque, NM 87113 Houston, TX 77046
(505) 344-9380 (832) 676-3391

Certification: All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that
full compliance is made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil and Gas
Orders, the approved Plan of Operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees.

The Operator will be fullyresponsible for the actions of its subcontractors. A complete
copy of the approved "Application for Permit to Drill" will be furnished to the field
representative(s) to ensure compliance and shall be on location during all construction
and drilling operations.

El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company is considered to be the operator of the subject
well. El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company agrees to be responsible under the terms
and conditions of the lease for the operations conducted upon leased lands.

Bond coverage pursuant to 43 CFR 3104 for the lease activities is beingprovided by
Lessee StatewideBlanket Bond No.400JUO705.

I hereby certify that the proposed drill site and access route has been inspected, and I am
familiar with the conditions that currently exist; that the statements made in this plan are,
to the best of my knowledge, true and correct; and the work associated with the
operations proposed herein will be performed by the Operator, its contractors, and
subcontractors in conformity with this plan and the terms and conditions under which it is
approved.

NaÁ Date 10/20/04

Authorized Agent for El Paso Production O&G



OTranscontinent Oil Company

September 14, 2004

Lake Fork Ranch, Inc.
Brent Brotherson, President
HC65 Box 510048, Mountain Home, UT 84051-9801

Re: Waiver of Archeological Survey
El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company
Brotherson 2-24B4 Oil and Gas Well
T2S-R4W Sec. 24: SW/4

Dear Mr. Brotherson;

As an Independent Landman for El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company, "El Paso". I've been
authorized to request from you a "Waiver of Archeological Survey" whereby you hereby waive and
release El Paso from doing an Archeological Survey upon the referenced lands that El Paso is going
to conduct surface operations on.

NOW THEREFORE,
I, THE UNDERSIGNED SURFACE OWNER, AGREE AND ACCEPTED THAT NO
ARCHEOLOGICAL SURVEY IS REQUIRED BY ME, THE UNDERSIGNED SURFACE
OWNER, FOR THE REFERENCED WELL ON THE REFERENCED LANDS, AND HEREBY
WAIVE AND RELEASE EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY FROM
CONDUCTING ANY ARCHEOLOGICAL SURVEY OF THE REFERENCED LANDS.

AGREED TO THIS / DAY OF Ô C Ë©r, 2004, BY AND BETWEEN:

Lak Fork Ranch, Inc.

Brent Brotherson, President

Donna Brotherson, Secretary

Tohn Whiteside
Independent Landman for
El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company

621 17thSt., Suite 1201, Denver, CO 80293-1201
Phone (303) 298-8108 - Fax (303)



anscontinent Oil Compan

September 14, 2004

Lake Fork Ranch, Inc.
Brent Brotherson, President
HC65 Box 510048, Mountain Home, UT 84051-9801

Re: Waiver of Archeological Survey
El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company
Brotherson 2-24B4 Oil and Gas Well
T2S-R4W See. 24: SW/4

Dear Mr. Brotherson;

As an Independent Landman for El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company, "El Paso". Pve been
authorized to request from you a "Waiver of Archeological Survey" whereby you hereby waive and
release El Paso from doing an Archeological Survey upon the referenced Iands that EI Paso is going
to conduct surface operations on.

NOW THEREFORE,
I, THE UNDERSIGNED SURFACE OWNER, AGREE AND ACCEPTED THAT NO
ARCHEOLOGICAL SURVEY IS REQUIRED BY ME, THE UNDERSIGNED SURFACE
OWNER, FOR THE REFERENCED WELL ON THE REFERENCED LANDS, AND HEREBY
WAIVE AND RELEASE EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY FROM
CONDUCTING ANY ARCHEOLOGICAL SURVEY OF THE REFERENCED LANDS.

AGREED TO THIS Í DAY OF C , 2004, BY AND BETWEEN:

La Fork Ranch, Inc.

Rrent Brotherson, President

Donna Brotherson, Secretary

John Whiteside
Independent Landman for
El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company

621 17* St., Suite 1201, Denver, CO 80293-1201
Phone (303) 298-8108 - Fax (303)



anscontinent Oil Compan

September 14, 2004

Lake Fork Ranch, Inc.
Brent Brotherson, President
HC65 Box 510048, Mountain Home, UT 84051-9801

Re: Waiver of Archeological Survey
El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company
Brotherson 2-24B4 Oil and Gas Well
T28-R4W See. 24: SWl4

Dear Mr. Brotherson;

As an Independent Landman for El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company, "El Paso". Pve been
authorized to request from you a "Waiver of Archeological Survey" whereby you hereby waive and
release El Paso from doing an Archeological Survey upon the referenced lands that El Paso is going
to conduct surface operations on.

NOW THEREFORE,
I, THE UNDERSIGNED SURFACE OWNER, AGREE AND ACCEPTED THAT NO
ARCHEOLOGICAL SURVEY IS REQUIRED BY ME, THE UNDERSIGNED SURFACE
OWNER, FOR THE REFERENCED WELL ON THE REFERENCED LANDS, AND HEREBY
WAIVE AND RELEASE EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY FROM
CONDUCTING ANY ARCHEOLOGICAL SURVEY OF THE REFERENCED LANDS.

AGREED TO THIS Í DAY OF ch>b
, 2004, BY AND BETWEEN:

La Fork Ranch, Inc.

Brent Brotherson, President

Donna Brotherson, Secretary

John Whiteside
Independent Landman for
El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company

621 17 St., Suite 1201, Denver, CO 80293-1201
Phone (303) 298-8108 - Fax (303)
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DAMAGE SETTLEMENT AND RELEASE

STATE OF UTAH §
§

COUNTY OF DUCHESNE §

Lake Fork Ranch, Inc. by Brent Brotherson President of HC65 Box 510048,
Mountain Home, UT 84051-9801, hereafter referred to as "Surface Owner", acknowledges
receipt of the sum of Three Thousand Dollars and 00/100 ($3,000.00)from El Paso Production
Oil & Gas Company hereafter referred to as "El Paso", being full settlement, satisfaction and
discharge of any and all claims against El Paso, its agents, contractors, employees, successors
and assigns for any and all injuries or damages of every character and description sustained by
Surface Owner or Surface Owner's property as a result of operations associated with the drilling
of Brotherson 2-24B4 Well to be located in the SWl4 of Section 24, Township 2 South Range
4 West, USM, Duchesne County, being 160.00 acres of land, more or less.

In addition, El Paso shall have the option, but not the obligation to land farm the mud
cuttings generated by the drilling of the above mentioned well in compliance to the regulations
set forth by the Department of Oil Gas and Minerals for the State of Utah

In consideration of the sum paid to Surface Owners as set out above, the undersigned
hereby remise, release and forever discharge and give full acquittance to El Paso, its partners,
successors and assigns from all and every actions, claim and demand against it as aforesaid.

This instrument may be executed in multiple counterparts with each counterpart being
considered an original for all purposes herein and binding upon the party executing same
whether or not this instrument is executed by all parties hereto, and the signature and
acknowledgment pages of the various counterparts hereto may be combined into one instrument
for the purposes of recording this instrument in the records of the County Clerk's office.

Executed this day of , 2004.

SURFACE OWNER:
Lake Fork Ranch, Inc.

By: Brent Brotherson, President

By: Donna Brotherson, Secretary

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

STATE OF ÌÅÌ Œ¾ }

COUNTY OF ( ) ? , }

BEFORE me, the undersigned, a Notary Public in and fore said County and State, on this S day of
\ p , 2004, personally appeared Brent Brotherson, as President and Donna

Brotherson, as Secretary of and for Lake For Rank, Inc., both to me known to be the identical person(s) who
executed the within and foregoing instrument, and acknowledged to me that they executed the same as a free and
voluntary act and deed, for theuses and purposes therein set forth.

Given under my hand and seal the day and year last above written.

otary Public

My Commission
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EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY

BROTHERSON #2-24B4
LOCATED IN DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

SECTION 24, T2S, R4W, U.S.B.&M.

PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #5 TO LOCATION STAKE CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHEASTERLY

PROPOSED ACCESS

PHOTO: VIEW FROM BEGINNING OF PROPOSED ACCESS CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHEASTERLY

, Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying LOCATIONPHOTOs 10 0 04 ruoro
85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 MONTII DAY YEAR

- Since 1964. 435-789-1017 uels@uelsinc.com TAKENBY:0.A. DRAWNBY:P.M.



EL PA PRODUCTION OIL & GAS OMPANY FIGURE #i
LOCATION LAYOUT FOR

's,,b BROTHERSON #2-24B4
, i

SECTION 24, T2S, R4W, U.S.B.&M.
1500' FSL 950' FWL

Propdosed Acce

AT ,oscAELE:1CO6--60
Apepro . E. 205 '

Drawn By· D.R.B
Fill Slope

- 100' Sta. J+50
Appro .

Cu Slope

NOTE
Rare Pit is to
be located a rnin.
of 100' frorn the
We// Head

I Ill!

PIPE RACKS
8. 212. 7
C-14.5 C-2.0' C-0.7' C--0.'5'

E/. 208.9' g 2Qg.7' ¯-4.6'

DOG HOUSE
160' Sta. 1+75

ESO )/TS
- g I I PUMP

TOILET
-- -a.- MUD SHED

Total P/t Capacity HOPPER
o

--- W/2' of Freeboard
--- = 24,900 Bb/s± POWER

Total Pit Volume
= 6, 780 Gu. Yds

TOOLS

FUEL
E/. 209.8'

Sta. 0+40
_ g g'

A

C-0.8' C-0. J' E-2.9'
E/. 209.0' E/. 208.5' 8. 205. J'

Bev. Ungraded Ground at Location Stake = 6208.7'
, UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYINGBev. Graded Ground at Location Stoke = 6208.2 as s, zoo ,,,, , y,,,,,, yes, e,,,, ,



EL PA PRODUCTION OIL & GAS OMPANY FIGURE #2
TYPICAL CROSS SECTIONS FOR '

o
×-section BROTHERSON #2-24B4

scale SECTION 24, T2S, R4W, U.S.B.&M.

1" = 100 1500' FSL 950' FWL

DATE: 10-06-04
Drawn By D.R.B. 100' 160'

-----
--- CUT

F/LL

SM. J+50

210' 160'

LOCATION STAKE

S M. 1+ 75

15' 150' 45' 160'

Finished Grade Slope= 1 1/2: 1

JIEllEllEllEllEllF¯U

SM. 0+40

Preconstruction 45' 160'
Grade

----
----- CUT

E/LL
NOTE:

ITopsoil should not be SM. 0+00
Stripped Below Finished
Grade on Substructure Area.

* NOTE
EILL QUANT/TY /NCLUDES

APPROXIMATE YARDAGES
5% EOR COMPACT/0N

EXCESS MATERIAL = 7,060 Cu. Yds.
(6") Topsoil Stripping = 2,210 Cu. Yds. Topsoil & Pit Backfill = 5,600 Cu. Yds.

Rernaining Location = 10,140 Cu. Yds. (1/2 Pit Vol.)

EXCESS UNBALANCE = 1,460 Cu. Yds.
TOTAL CUT = 12,350 CU,YDS. (After Rehabilitation)

FILL = 5,290 CU.YDS. UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
85 So. 200 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (436)



AMONT

PROPOSED LOCATION
BROTHERSON #2-24B4

T2S

WW
L/ 1632

LEGEND: EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY

PROPOSED LOCATION N BROTHERSON #2-24B4
SECTION 24, T2S, R4W, U.S.B.&M.

1500' FSL 950' FWL

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I C
¯

85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 M A P ONT DAY YEAR
(435) 789--1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813

SÇALE:þ100,000DRAWNBY:P.M. EVISED:



NT 7.3 ML +/-

PROPOSED LOCATION:

LEGEND: EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY
EXISTING ROAD N BROTHERSON #2-24B4

----------- PROPOSED ACCESS ROAD SECTION 24, T2S, R4W, U.S.B.&M.
1500' FSL 950' FWL

- Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I c 10 06 04 ¡85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 M A P MONT DAY YEAR
(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813

SCALE:1"= 2000'. DRAWNBY:P.M..REVISED:00



LEGEND: EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY
pf DISPOSAL WELLS WATER WELLS N BROTHERSON #2-24B4
O PRODUCING WELLS ABANDONED WELLS SECTION 24, T2S, R4W, U.S.B.&M.

SHUT IN WELLS - - TEMPORARILY ABANDONED 1500' FSL 950' FWL

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I cl 0 06 04
85 South 200 East VernnI, Utah 84078 M A P nonvu »Av vrAa

(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
SCALE:1" = 2000' DRAWNBY:P.M. REVISED:
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. . 06292
. . EXISTING PIPELINE)

o ...., , . ..

·· 4

PROPOSED LOCATION:

R

APPROXIMATE TOTAL PIPELINE DISTANCE = 1,791' +/-

LEGEND: EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY
PROPOSED ACCESS ROAD N BROTHERSON #2-24B4

-------- EXISTING PIPELINE SECTION 24, T2S, R4W, U.S.B.&M.
------------ PROPOSED PIPEI INE

1500' FSL 950' FWL

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I c 10!06 04
85 South 200 East VernnI, Utah 84078 M A P AIONTII DAY YEAR

a (435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789--1813
SCALE:1" = 1000' DRAWNBY:P.M. REVISED:
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g WORKSHEET

0 0 3 APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 10/22/2004 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-013-32695

WELL NAME: BROTHERSON 2-24 B4

OPERATOR: EL PASO PROD OIL & GAS ( N1845 )

CONTACT: CHERYL CAMERON PHONE NUMBER: 505-344-9380

PROPOSED LOCATION:

RWSW 24 020S 040W INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /

SURFACE: 1500 FSL 0950 FWL Tech Review Initials Date

DUCHE E

1500 FSL 0950 FWL
Engineering

ALTAMONT ( 55 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 4 - Fee Surface
LEASE NUMBER: FEE

SURFACE OWNER: 4 - Fee
LATITUDE: 40.29007

PROPOSED FORMATION: WSTC

COALBED METHANE WELL? NO LONGITUDE: -110.2899

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

97 Plat R649-2-3.

\/ Bond: Fed[] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[]
Unit

(No . () )
Potash (Y/N) R649-3-2. General

66 Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920'Between Wells

\/ Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception

(No. 43-8496 )
Drilling Unit

RDCC Review (Y/N)
(Date: )

Board Cause No: jÇ. /g
Eff Date:

Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting: Ín/p u F / 20'Ñ o sr µLtJt

R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS: a ic/ OM

STIPULATIONS: (
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BABCDCK2,1286
e *

T2S R4W
noncoc=2.22"* i T2S R3W

M3RINRANCH

I 13B4
• BABWKI-18B3

ßHUlHIRS N
2 1484 e 14 II

MlRIN RANCH
2-lhH3 e

LAKE FORK
2·13DIR*

CAUSE:139-42/4-17-1985

BKOIllhRSON
LiANSUIE

121HI
119H3 *

BROEHEHhON
1-2484 e

LAKEFORK
2-23B6 |

LVAN 2 19U3

BROTHE SON
BROIHERSON 2-2484

3-2384 e

ALTAMONT FIELD

IIROlHERSON
1-2584 *

HROlHERSON
. 1-2684•

30

2í 25 BROTHERSON
130BS w

OPERATOR: EL PASO PROD OdcG CO (N1845)

SEC. 24 T.2S R.4W

FIELD: ALTAMONT (55)

COUNTY: DUCHESNE

CAUSE: 139-42 / 4-17-1985 Utah Oi!Gas and Mining
.Vells Units.shp Pields.shp

/ GAS INJECTION EXPLORATORY ABANDONED
o GAS STORAGE GAS STORAGE ACTIVE
X LOCATION ABANDONED

NF PP OIL COMBINED NNEW LOCATION
+ PLUGGED & ABANDONED NF SECONDARY INACTIVE

PRODUCING GAS PENDING PROPOSED
g PRODUCING OIL PI OIL STORAGE E
o SHUT-IN GAS FP GAS TERMINATED
• SHUT-IN OIL PP GEUTHERML 5
X TEMP. ABANDONED

TEST WELL PP OIL

WATER INJECTION SECONDARY

• WATER SUPPLY TERMINATED PREPARED BY:DIANA WHITNEY

a WATER DISPOSAL DATE:
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ON- SITE PREDRILL EVALUATION

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

OPERATOR: El Paso Production oil & Gas Company
WELL NAME & NUMBER: Brotherson 2-24B4

API NUMBER: 43-013-32695

LEASE: FEE FIELD/UNIT: ALTAMONT/BLUEBELL
LOCATION: 1/4,1/4 NW/SW Sec: 24 TWP: 02S RNG: 04W 1500 FSL 950 FWL
LEGAL WELL SITING: 660' from uiit boundary and 1320' from another well.
GPS COORD (UTM): X =0560356 E; Y =4459981 N SURFACE OWNER: Brent Brotherson

PARTICIPANTS
Dennis L. Ingram (DOGM) Robert Wilkins & John Whiteside (El Paso);

Andrew Palmer (Uintah Engineering Land & Survey)

REGIONAL/LOCAL SETTING & TOPOGRAPHY

El Paso has proposed a well site approximately 5.7 +/- miles south of
Altamont on northern portion of a broad bench in undeveloped rural type
setting or rangeland. Lake Fork River and Pigeon Water Creek join
northwest of this site and are located 1.0 mile to the northeast and run
in a southeasterly direction. Big Sand Wash and the town of Upaclo are
found approximately 3.5 miles further east and across the Lake Fork
drainage system. To the south, the elevation drops off onto what is
called Blue bench.

SURFACE USE PLAN

CURRENT SURFACE USE: Livestock grazing and wildlife use, winter range

PROPOSED SURFACE DISTURBANCE: Proposed 0.3 +/- miles of new access road
in from west plus location measuring 350'x 305' plus temporary reserve
pit and soil spoils storage outside of described area.

LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHIN A 1 MILE RADIUS: #2-13B4R; #1-23B4;
#2-23B4; #1-24B4; #3-23B4; #1-26B4; and #1-25B4.

LOCATION OF PRODUCTION FACILITIES AND PIPELINES: Tanks and production
equipment shall remain on location with gas pipeline leaving north and
tied into existing pipeline.

SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL: Native cut and fill

ANCILLARY FACILITIES: None requested

WILL DRILLING AT THIS LOCATION GENERATE PUBLIC INTEREST OR CONCERNS?
(EXPLAIN): NO, PRIVATE LANDS

WASTE MANAGEMENT PLAN:

Submitted to the Division with Application to



ENVIRONMENTAL PARAMETE

AFFECTED FLOODPLAINS AND/OR WETLANDS: None present (Lake Fork Drainage
approximately 1.0 mile northeast of location).

FLORA/FAUNA: Typical pinyon/juniper habitat, rabbit brush, sagebrush;
primary winter range for mule deer and elk, smaller mammals and birds
native to region.

SOIL TYPE AND CHARACTERISTICS: reddish brown fine-rained sandy loam

SURFACE FORMATION & CHARACTERISTICS: Uinta Formation

EROSION/SEDIMENTATION/STABILITY: Minor erosion, some sedimentation, no
stability problems.

PALEONTOLOGICAL POTENTIAL: None observed during onsite visit

RESERVE PIT

CHARACTERISTICS: Proposed on south side of location in cut, measuring
150'x 150' x 10' deep and downwind from wellhead.

LINER REQUIREMENTS (Site Ranking Form attached): 25 points

SURFACE RESTORATION/RECLAMATION PLAN

According to landowner agreement or contour and seeded.

SURFACE AGREEMENT: Yes

CULTURAL RESOURCES/ARCHAEOLOGY: Landowner Waiver

OTHER OBSERVATIONS/COMMENTS

Surface slopes to east, no surface water observed, no drainage problems
along access road or on proposed location, sandy surface with good
vegetative cover, elk and deer tracks on location.

ATTACHMENTS

Photos of this location were taken and placed on file.

Dennis L. Ingram 11/08/04 9:30 AM
DOGM REPRESENTATIVE



luation Ranking Criteria and Ranking re
For Reserve and Onsite Pit Liner Requirements

Site-Specific Factors Ranking Site Ranking

Distance to Groundwater (feet)
>200 0
100 to 200 5
75 to 100 10
25 to 75 15
<25 or recharge area 20 _0

Distance to Surf. Water (feet)
>1000 0
300 to 1000 2
200 to 300 10
100 to 200 15
< 100 20 0

Distance to Nearest Municipal
Well (feet)

>5280 0
1320 to 5280 5
500 to 1320 10
<500 20 0

Distance to Other Wells (feet)
>1320 0
300 to 1320 10
<300 20 0

Native Soil Type
Low permeability 0
Mod. permeability 10
High permeability 20 20

Fluid Type
Air/mist 0
Fresh Water 5
TDS >5000 and <10000 10
TDS >10000 or Oil Base Mud Fluid 15

containing significant levels of
hazardous constituents 20 5

Drill Cuttings
Normal Rock 0
Salt or detrimental 10 0

Annual Precipitation (inches)
<10 0
10 to 20 5
>20 10 O

Affected Populations
<10 0
10 to 30 6
30 to 50 8
>50 10 0

Presence of Nearby Utility
conduits

Not Present 0
Unknown 10
Present 15 0

Final Score 25 (Level I Sensitivity)

Sensitivity Level I = 20 or more; total containment is required, consider criteria for excluding pit use.
Sensitivity Level II = 15-19; lining is discretionary.
Sensitivity Level III = below 15; no specific lining is required
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Well name: 12-04 EI Paso Brotherson 2-24B4
operator: El Paso Production Company
String type: Surface Project ID:

43-013-32695
Location: Duchesne County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.500 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 79 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length; 200 ft

Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface

Burst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: -26 psi
Internal gradient: 0.468 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 441 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 6,200 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.900 ppg
Neutral point: 874 ft Next setting BHP: 2,866 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 1,000 ft
Injection pressure 1,000 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft')
1 1000 13.375 54.50 J-55 Buttress 1000 1000 12.49 107.7

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 441 1130 2.560 441 2730 6.19 54 853 15.66 B

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Phone: 801-538-5280 Date: December 2,2004
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining FAX: 801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: Surface casing cemented to surface; Oil shale
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 1000 ft, a mud weight of 8.5 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsíbility for use of this design willbe that of the
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Well name: 12-04 El Paso Brotherson 2-24B4
Operator: El Paso Production Company
String type: Intermediate Project ID:

43-013-32695
Location: Duchesne County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.900 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 152 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,000 ft

Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 4,467 ft

Burst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 4,274 psi
Internal gradient: 0.120 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 5,018 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 10,700 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 10.000 ppg
Neutral point: 5,379 ft Next setting BHP: 5,558 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 6,200 ft
Injection pressure 6,200 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft3)
1 6200 9.625 40.00 HCN-80 LT&C 6200 6200 8.75 493.1

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 2866 4230 1.476 5018 5750 1.15 248 837 3.38 J

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Phone: 801-538-5280 Date: December 2,2004
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining FAX:801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STlPULATIONS: Surface casing cemented to surface; Oil shale
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 6200 ft, a mud weight of 8.9 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design willbe that of the
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Well name: 12-04 El Paso Brotherson 2-24B4
operator: El Paso Production Company
String type: Production Project ID:

43-013-32695
Location: Duchesne County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 10.000 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 215 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 368 ft

Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 8,855 ft

Burst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 556 psi
Internal gradient: 0.468 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 5,558 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 9,080 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft')
1 10700 7 29.00 P-110 LT&C 10700 10700 6.059 627.8

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
i 5558 8530 1.535 5558 11220 2.02 310 797 2.57 J

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Phone: 801-538-5280 Date: December 2,2004
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining FAX:801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: Surface casing cemented to surface; Oil shale
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 10700 ft, a mud weight of 10 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design willbe that of the
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Well name: 12-04 El Paso Brotherson 2-24B4
operator: El Paso Production Company
String type: Production Liner Project ID:

43-013-32695
Location: Duchesne County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 13.000 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F

Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 244 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft

Minimum section length: 1,500 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 11,239 ft

Burst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 6,938 psi
Internal gradient: 0.131 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 8,610 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 10,227 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft3)
1 12750 5 18.00 P-110 ST-L 12750 12750 4.151 467

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 8610 13470 1.564 8610 13940 1.62 230 384 1.67 J

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Phone: 801-538-5280 Date: December 2,2004
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining FAX: 801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: Surface casing cemented to surface; Oil shale
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 12750 ft, a mud weight of 13 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design willbe that of the
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DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

STATEMENT OF BASIS

OPERATOR: El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company
WELL NAME & NUMBER: Brotherson #2-24B4
API NUMBER: 43-013-32695
LOCATION: 1/4,1/4 NW/SW See: 24 TWP: 2 S RNG: 4W 1500 FSL 950 FWL

Geology/Ground Water:

El Paso proposes to set 1,000 feet of surface casing which will be cemented to surface. The estimated depth to
the base of moderately saline ground water is 3,200 feet. A search of Division of Water Rights records
indicates that there are over 40 water wells within a 10,000 foot radius of the proposed location. The nearest
water well is approximately 1/4 mile from the proposed site. Most of these wells produce water from the
Duchesne River Formation and are less than 200 feet deep. Intermediate casing string cement should be
brought up above the base of the moderately saline ground water. The proposed casing and cementing program
should adequately protect the highly used Duchesne River aquifer.

Reviewer: Brad Hill Date: 01/05/2005

Surface:

The Division Staff scheduled and performed a presite meeting to take input and address issues regarding the
permitting and construction of this well. Brent Brotherson (435) 454-3546 was shown as the landowner or President
of the William Brotherson et ut trust and was therefore invited to participate in the presite meeting. Brent did not
attend but did make a follow up telephone call to me the following day asking how everything went. He did not
offer any remarks about the drilling of this well, other than it's used for grazing and has good feed and ground cover.
The access road and location is relatively flat and slopes gently toward the east. There weren't any drainage
problems that would indicate a culvert or cattle guard is needed, since no stock fences fall within the project area.
Brotherson did say they graze cattle in this area but did not request fencing around location. The surface soil on
location is loose and sandy and therefore a synthetic liner in the reserve pit is probably advisable.

Reviewer: Dennis L. Ingram Date: November 15, 2004

Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill:

1. A synthetic liner with a minimum thickness of 12 mills shall be properly installed and maintained in the reserve



12-04 El Paso Brotherson 2- B4
Casing Schematic
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Well Master

Weil Name

Completion Infomintion f ilÍcreensOpen Hole, or Perforated Intervals

Tp RMD- Notes
4200 5831 )

Well-Specific Zones (e.g., Injection Zone, Producing Zone, USDWs, Confining Zone, etc. Formations Intersecting a Zone

Type ofZone State Assigned Production Fmtn Prod Status T.
=roduction Zone Green River-Wasatch
njection Interval
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STATE OF UTAH, DIVISIO OF WATER RIGHTS Page 1 of 2

WRPLAT Program Output Listing

Version: 2004.11.16.00 Rundate: 11/16/2004 10:44 AM

Radius search of 10000 feet from a point N1500 E950 from the SW corner, section 24, Township
2S, Range 4W, US b&m Criteria:wrtypes=W,C,E podtypes=U status=U,A,P usetypes=all

15 14 13
18 +43

19'

43-1145#

4Ù10771
43-10891

43-8362

43-11314 23 24

43-9207

,
27 26 25

30

4 7325 31
34 . 35 36

0 1300 2600 3900 5200 ft

http://utstnrwrt6.waterrights.utah.gov/cgi-bin/mapserv.exe



STATE OF UTAH, DIVISIO F WATER RIGHTS Page 2 of2

Water Rights

WR Diversion Well Status Priority Uses CFS ACFT Ownei
Number Type/Location Log

43-10771 Underground P 19970826 DI 0.000 0.690 ROBERT W. VAN
- - info

N1260 W256 S4 15 2S P.O. BOX 1094
4W US

well ROBERT AND DI43-10891 Underground . A 19990211 DIS 0.000 4.730
info JENKINS

NS80 W450 S4 14 2S 4W P. O. BOX 178
US

43-11181 Underground A 20010824 DIS 0.000 3.730 PAUL & VERLEN
info

N420 E1775 W4 22 2S 31 NORTH 400 W
4W US

ALAN AND KAY43-11314 Underground A 20021011 DI 0.000 1.200 SUNDQUIST
N120 E2250 W4 22 2S 790 W 10 N
4W US

DONALD B. ANE43-l_1_450 Underground A 20030711 DI 0.000 0.990 CAMPBELL
S776 E1676 W4 15 2S 486 NORTH 2000
4W US

well43-1991 Underground P 19681119 DIS 0.015 0.000 MYRIN RANCH I
info

Sl72 W535 E4 18 2S 3W ALTAMONT UT i
US

43-7325 Underground P 19750902 O 0.015 0.000 INC. FUEL EXPLI

S914 W544 NE 34 2S 1860 LINCOLN S'
4W US

43-8362 Underground we P 19790104 O 0.015 0.000 SHELL OIL COMinfo
S453 W2320 NE 23 2S P.O. BOX #831
4W US

43-9207 Underground A 19820526 S 0.015 0.000 BRENT BROTHE
S550 W1627 NE 25 2S STAR ROUTE BC
4W US

Natural Resources | Contact \ _Disclaimer | Privacy Policy \ Accessibility Policy

http://utsturwrt6.waterrights.utah.gov/cgi-bin/mapserv.exe
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STATE OF UTAH FORM9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONANOSERIALNUMBER:

FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTSON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITorCA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do notuse this form for proposais io dilli newwells,significantlydeepen existingwellsbelow cunentbottom-hole depth, reenier plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER BROTHERSON 2-24B4

2. NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9. APINUMBER:

EL PASO PRODUCTIONOIL & GAS COMPANY
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1339 EL SEGUNDO NE crry ALBUQUERQUE STATE NM Z1P87113 (505) 344-9380 ALTAMONTIBLUEBELL
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FODTAGESATSURFACE: 1500' FSL, 950' FWL couvry: DUCHENE

GTRÆlTR,SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWSW 24 2S 4W STATE:
UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

NOTICEOF INTENT
ActDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximale date work will- O CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETo PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOFWELLSITE OTHER: CHANGE TO
O CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE-DIFFERENTFORMATION ORIGINALAPD

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

ATTACHEDIS THE AMENDEDDRILLINGPROGNOSIS AS REQUESTED BYTHE STATE OF UTAH,DIVISIONOF OIL
GAS, AND MINING,WITHTHE FOLLOWINGCHANGES:

13 3/8" SURFACE CSG SET @ 1000'

9 5/8" TOP MOVEDUP TO 3700'

NAME(PLEASEPRIO CHERYLCAMERON TITLE REGULATORYANALYST

SGNATURE / 1 UM DATE 11/29/2004

(This space for stateuse only)

NE) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DIVOFOIL,GAS&



O O
O p3SO Procluction

Drillina Proanosis

COMPANY NAME El Paso Pmduction DATE November24, 2004

WELLNAME BrodierBOR #2-2488 TD 12,750' MDfTVD

FIELD Altamont - Bluebell COUNTY Duchesne STATE Utah

SURFACELOCATION 1,500' FSL, 950' FWL, NWISW, SEC. 24, T28, R4W BHL Stmlpht Hole

OBJECTIVE ZONE(8) Green River, Waeatch
ADDITIONALINFO 13-518"5M BOP etackand 5M Idillines and cholœmanifold

MECHANICAL
HOLE CASING MUD

LOSS TOPS DEPTH SIžE SizE WEIGHT

17-1/2" 13-WB",54.6#, J-SS. BTC 8 SALS979

1,000 ' MDITVD WBM

TOC @3,700' 9-518", 40#, HCN-80. LTC ui

SWD perfs Wa.1

5,000' to TD Green River @ 5,050' @420045831

6,200 ' MDITVD

Tot g so,soo·

TOC @10,600'

Platform Express/SoniclFMI

li 1 5" 18# P-110.STL(FJ)

12,750



Page 2/2

DRILLING PROGRAM

CAsiNG PROGRAM

2 730 1,130 863,000
SURFACE 13-3/8 0-100& 54.50 J-SS BTC 5 36 2.41 5.52

4,230
N l a16DI^TE s bd 0 -

6,200• 10 lli. HC F lH 1 65 1 46 : A l

i

13 940 13,470 vt1 tiati

PRODLICEil NLINEl 5 10500'-12,750' 18 P lits ST-I (F I 204 156 día

SURFACE

Lead 1,000 Premium + 2% CaCl2+.25 ppe Flooele 1222 100% 15.60 1.17

INFFNMllll i I Iri siiilil CBMLight 1r. "i". :t il dilt

I iil 500 50/50 Poz + 0 6% Halad-322+ 5 pps Gilsonite 1til TML I il .16 1 .C

+5% Salt + 1 pps Granulite

i . :ll i .
II.i .

I

PRODLI ] N LINER Ill 10700-12750 Premium+ 5%Halad-344+35%SSA-1 130 .% 15 FF : is

ill 2,050 + 0 4% CFR-3+ 4% HR-12

l.iin r ail 100

PLOAT ROUIPMENT & CENTRALizERS

SURFACE Float shoe, 1 joint,float collar. Centralize 5' atxwe shoe & 5 centralizersevery thirdcollar. Thread look FE
& bottom joint.

INTERMEDIATE I loat shoe, 1 Joint, float collar Centralize eveiy 4th joint to 3700' Thread lock all FE

LINER Float shoe, 1 joint,float collar Centralize every 4th jointto top of pay Thread
lock all FE

PROJECT ENGINEER: BuddyNovak

DRILLINGMANAGER: Scott



j')BSO Production

prillinaProanosis
COMPANY NAME El Paso Production DATE October 18, 2004
WELL NAME BrOUterson #2-2484 TD 12,75&MDfTVD
FIELD Altamont - Bluebell COUNTY Ducheene STATE Utah
SURFACELOCATION 1,500'FSL,950' FWL, NWISW, SEC.24, T28, R4W BHL SkalghtHole
OBJECTIVE ZONE(S) Green River, Wasatch
ADDITIONALINFO

MECHANICAL
HOLE CASING MUD

LOUS TOPE DEPTN BlžE SizE WEIGHT
Cement to surface

200 ' MDITVD J 17-1/2" 13-3/8" Pro-Set

12-1/4" 9-5/8", 40#, HCN-80, LTO 8 5-8 9 ppg
TOC @6,000' WBM

i l i I i 5,000' to TD Green River @ 6,050'

6,200 ' MDITVD

TOL @10,500'

TOC @10,600'

Platform Express/Sonic/FMI

1 11 5" 18#, P-110 ST-L (FJ) 10 I I I l i

12,760



Page 2/2

DRILLING PROGRAM

CAsiNo PROGRAM

5,750 4 230 837.000

SURFACi 9-5/8" O - 6,200' 40 00 HCN-80 LTC 1 65 1 46 2.41

i : i .:I : II 0 - 10,700' P-110 LTC
13 940 13.470 341.000

PRODUCTION LINER 5" 10,500' -12,750' 18 P-110 ST-L ff li 2 04 1.56 2.49

Pmset

SURFACE Lead 700 Premium Plus + 2% Econolite + 2% Cai-seal 70 25% 10 50 4 10

+
.3% Versaset

Tall 500 50/50 Poz + 0 6% Halad-322+ 5 pps Gilsonite 180 25% 14 25 1 22
+5% Salt + 1 pps Gmnulite

INTERMEDIATE ,
8000-10700 50/50 Poz FO25 lb/sk Flocele+5 pps Silicate 360 25% 13 50 1 46

ill 2 700 + 0 1% HR-12 + 2% CFR-3

PRODUCTION LINER Fill 10700-12750 Premium + 5% Halad-344+ 35% SSA-1 130 25% 15 60 1 56

Fill 2,050 + 0 4% CFR-3+ 4% HR-12

Linel Lap 100

FLOAT ROUIPMENT & CENTRALI2BRB

SURFACE Eloal shoe, 1 joint,float collar Centralize 5' above shoe & 5 centralizers every thirdcollar Thread lock FE

& bottom joint

INTERMEDIATE Float shoe, 1 joint,float collar Centralize every 4th jointto 8000' Thread look all FE

PRODUCTION FJoat shoe, 1 Joint, float collar Centralize every 4th jointto top of pay Thread
locWall FE

PROJECTENGINEER: BuddyNovak

DRILLINGMANAGER: Scott



9
EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY

BROTHERSON #2-24B4
SECTION 24, T2S, R4W, U.S.B.&M.

PROCEED IN A WESTERLY DIRECTION FROM ALTAMONT, UTAH
APPROXIMATELY 2.3 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHEAST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHEASTERLY, THEN SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.9
MILES TO THE JLWCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE
EAST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY, THEN SOUTHERLY
DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 4.1 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD
AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHEAST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN
A SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.5 MILES TO THE
REGINNING OF THE PROPOSED ACCESS T THE RAST FOLLOW ROAD
FLAGS IN AN EASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.3 MILES TO THE
PROPOSED LOCATíON.

LOCATION IS APPROXIMATELY 8.1



g e
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLUTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITorCA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do notuse thisibrm for pmposals todrill new wells,significantly deepen existing wells below cunent bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for suchproposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER BROTHERSON 2-24B4
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER

EL PASO PRODUCTIONOIL&GAS COMPANY
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:
1339 EL SEGUNDO NE on ALBUQUERQUE STATE NM ZIP87113 (505) 344-9380 ALTAMONT/BLUEBELL

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE 1500' FSL, 950'FWL COUNTY: DUCHESNE

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWSW 24 2S 4W STATE:
UTAH

9. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximale date workwill- O CASNG MR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSffE OTHER:

O CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, eto

ATTACHEDIS AN AMENDED DRILLING PROGNOSIS RECOMMENDED BY DUSTINDOUCET, STATE OF UTAH,DOGM.
THE TOC ON THE 9 5/8" CSG HAS BEEN BROUGHT BACK TO 3000'.

NAME(PLEASE CHERYLCAMERON y,,c, REGULATORYANALYST

SIGNATU = MTE 12/28/2004

Re RECEWED

(5/2000) (See Instruellons onReverse Side)

DIVOFOILGAS&



O O
paSO Production

COMPANYNAME ElPaeo Production DATE December 28, 2004
WELL NAME Brotherson #2-2486 TD 12,750' MDfTVD
FIELD Altamont- Bluebell COUMTYDucheene STATE Ulah
SURFACE LOCATION 1,500' FSL, 950' FWL,NWISW,SEC. 24, T28, R4W BHL Straight Hole
OBJECTIVE ZONE(S) Green River, Waeatch
ADDITIONALINFO 13-518" 5M BOP elackand 5M IdilIInes and choke manifald

MECHANICAL
HOLE CASING MUD

LOGS TOPS DEPTH SlžE SizE WEIGHT

17-1/2" 18-3tr, 54 5#. J-55 BTC 8.58 9 ppg

1.000 ' MDITVD J wsM

TOC @3,000' i 9-5/8" 40#, HCN-80, LTC

SWD perfs wr.M

i i il ll : 3.5,000' to TD Green River @ 6,060' g 4200-5831

6,200 ' MDITVD

TOL @10,500'

TOC @10,600'

Platform Express/Somc/FMI

r.. I| 5 18# P-110 ST-L (FJ) 10 0 3 0 ppg

12,760



g e Page 2/2

DRILLING PROGRAM

CASING PROGRAM

2.730 1,130 853,000
SURFACE 13-3/8 0-1000' 54.50 J-55 BTC 5.36 2.41 5 62

0 4,230 i -

flll PMFIllAli ½-SP" 0-6,200' -1|Hill H 118( e l'. 1re 146 11

I

1 Fil 13,470 trii
PR D:lCllllMilMER 5" iB500'-12750' 18 f 110 SI L (F.0 204 156 JO

BURFACE

Lead 1 000 Premium + 2% CaCI/ .25 ppe Flooele 1222 100% 15.80 1.17

INTERMEDIATE Lead 0 CBM Light _ 10 MI 1 TE.

Tail DI i I 50/50 Poz + 0 6% Halad-322+ 5 pps Gilsonite i 14 .6 i .32

+5% Salt + 1 pps Granulite

PR DLit I l N LINE R Fill 1 00 50 Premium + 5% Halad-344 + 35% SSA-1 13 Ofi 1 St.
Ill 2 flSir +04%CFR-3+ 4%HR-12

Liimr Lap 10tl

PLOAT EOUIPMENT A CENTRALIžRRB

SURFACE Float shoe, 1 joint,float collar Centralize 5' aboveshoe &5 centmlizeraevery thkdcoller.Thread lock FE
& bottom joint.

INTERMEDIATE Float shoe, 1 joint, float collar Centralize every 4th joint to 3000' Thread lock all FE

ut iEt,T Float shoe, 1 joint,float collar Centralize every 4th joint to top ofpay Thread
lock all FE

PROJECTENGINEER: Buddy Novak

DRILLINGMANAGER Scott



0 O
STATE OF UTAH FORM S

DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIV1SIONOF OIL, GAS ANDMINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER

FEE

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS & IFINDIARAtl.O~TEEORTR:BE NAMP

7. UNlTor CA AGREEMENTRAME
oo not a theon w proposais to e,ii n wens. enkann deepen emances oeis co,erocom-hole depteenw mogedwei °"° CA 96-000074

drill botzoti lateras Use APPLICATION COR ERM:T TO 3RILL form forecch proposals

1 , E OF WEL 8 WELL NAMEandNUMBER
OIL WELL / GAS WELL GTHER BROTHERSON 2-2484

2 MAME Œ D ERATOR 9 AP: MUMBER

EL PASO PRODUCTION OlL AND GAS COMPANY
3 ADDRESSOFOPERA'OR PHONENUMBÊN. 13 ½EL3AN OOL,ORWLOCAT

1339 EL SECUNDONE ALBUQUERQUE NM 87113 (505) 344-9380 ALTAMONT/BLUEBELL
4 -OCA'ONOrgi

oC AGESCSWAce 1500' FSL, 950' FWL :our- UINTAH

RC3.SEC'CN TOVASH:F RANGE VER2At NWSW 24 2S 4W a--
UTAH

. CHECKAPPROPRIATEBOXESTO lNDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION PE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN DRA'T ^. AREN- CORMATION

NOT CE OF I%TENT
(Subtrrt.n Dupacate) AL'IR CASING cRAC'Jqc -gejT ¯¯¾T<'O 97 A R

W¯_:

Aporommatedatem ikwriistat 3ASINGREPAIN
NEWCONSNUC-ON EvooRAR::VASANDON

O CHANGETOPREVIOUS LANS OP( RATOR CHANGE TLS.NG RE AIN

O HANGETJB1NG PL JG AN3 ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SlJOSGOUENTREPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLJG BACK ATERDISPOSA.

(Saturst OrKyna Jorn Omv:

O CHANGE WEL. STATUS PROOLCTION (STARTERESJME) NATER SHUT-OFU

Date of *WK compemo

O COMMINGLERCOUCNGFOWOOAS RECLAMATIONCFWE em ADD1TlON TO APD

O =osvr we == O RECOMP' ETE .]IFFERENT PCRMA"10N

2 JESCR 86 PROPOSE OR COMPLEED OPERATONS Clearlyshow all pe1:nen' detans includeg dates cepths volues. etc

THE PRESSURE(S) ISSUE FROM THE LAKEFOR 2-23B4 SWD WELL DOESN'T APPEAR TO BE A PROBLEM DUETO
THE PROPOSED WELL BEING ONE (1) MILEAWAYAS FAR AS THE RESERVOIR BEING CHARGED UP AND TRYlNG

TO FLOWWHILE DRILLING. OPERATOR'S PLAN ISTO DRILLTHIS INTERVAL(4200'- 5837) W1THAN 8.8-9.0 PPG

WSM., WFTHSOMECHLORIDEINCREASE IN THE MUD. OPERATOR SHALL BE MONITORING MUDPROPERT!ES
CLOSELY WHILE DRILLINGTHE SWD INTERVAL. MUDWEIGHTS &CHEMICALS SHALL BE ADJUSTEDAs NEEDED.

THE SWDWELL HAS NOT BEEN SHUT IN FOR MORE THANA DAY OR TWO INORDERTO SEE HOW MUCH THE
INJECTION PRESSURE FALLS. OPERATOR DISPOSES LARGEAMOUNTSOF SALTWATER DA1LYAND IT WILL
BECOME TOO EXPENS1VE TO TRUCKTHIS WATER INORDER TO SHUT THIS WELL IN.

[F THE S\ÑO ZONE BECOMES AN ISSUE WHlLE DRILLING,OPERATOR SHALL SHUT THIS WELL INANDMAKE
ARRANGEMENTS FOR WATER DISPOSAL AS NEEDED,

NAusot.eAsa
CHERYL CAMERON T'*LE REGULATORY ANALYST

5/2Coc; [See instructions on Reverse
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OLENE S. WALKER

Governor

GAYLEF. McKEACHNIE
Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah January 5, 2005

Department of
Natural Resources

ROBERT L. MORGAN El Paso Production Oil & Gas CompanyExecutive Director
1339 El Segundo NE

Division of Albuquerque, NM 87113
Oil, Gas & Mining

YD
D

rG
r Re: Brotherson 2-24 B4 Well, 1500' FSL, 950' FWL, NW SW, Sec. 24, T. 2 South,

R. 4 West, Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-013-32695.

Sincerely,

hn R. Baza
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Duchesne County Assessor

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801 &
telephone (801) 538-5340• facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 •www.ogm.utah.gov Where ideas



O O
Operator: El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company
Well Name & Number Brotherson 2-24 B4

API Number: 43-013-32695
Lease: Fee

Location: NW SW Sec. 24 T. 2 South R. 4 West

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following
actions during drilling of this well:
• 24 hours prior to cementing or testing casing
• 24 hours prior to testing blowout prevention equipment
• 24 hours prior to spudding the well
• within 24 hours of any emergency changes made to the approved drilling program
• prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well

The following are Division of Oil, Gas and Mining contacts and their work telephone
numbers (please leave a voice mail message if the person is not available to take the call):
• Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338
• Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284 (spud)

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. Compliance with the Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill outlined in the
Statement of Basis. (Copy Attached)

5. BOPE shall be tested in accordance with R649-3-7 - well



S E OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIALNUMBER:0 0 5 FEE
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:

Do notuse thisform for proposals to drllinew wells, significantly deepen existingwells below cunent bottom-hole depth, reenlerplugged wells,or1° 96-74
drill horizonlal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for suchproposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL Q OTHER BROTHERSON 2-24B4

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER

EL PASO PRODUCTIONOIL&GAS COMPANY 4301332695
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:

1339 EL SEGUNDO NE ALBUQUERQUE NM 87113 (505) 344-9380 ALTAMONT/BLUEBELL
4 LOCATIONOFWELL

FOJfAGESATSURFACE: 1500'FSL, 950'FWL COUNTY: ÐUCHESNE

QTROTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWSW 24 2S 4W STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximale date work willsia t CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUGTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

2/7/2005 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOFWELLSITE GTHER: CONFIDENTAL
O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION STATUS

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

OPERATOR REQUESTS THAT A CONFIDENTIALSTATUS BE PLACEDON THE SUBJECT WELL.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) CHERYLCAMERON TITLE REGULATORY ANALYST

SIGNATURE I la OMit Á DATE 2/7/2005

DIV.0F01L,GAS&



OST OF UTAH FORMS
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

ÛÛ$ FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLUTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNrTorCA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do notuse this form¾r proposals 10drill new wells,significantlydeepen exislingwells below cunentbottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells,or¾ 96-000074

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER BROTHERSON 2-24B4
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER

EL PASO PRODUCTIONOIL &GAS COMPANY - 4301332695
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:

1339 EL SEGUNDO NE C1TY
ALBUQUERQUE STATE NM ZIP 87113 (505) 344-9380 ALTAMONT/BLUEBELL

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1500' FSL, 950' FWL couary: DUCHESNE

QTR ITR,SEGTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWSW 24 2S 4W srATE
UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDI E DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximate date workwillstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCRON TEMPORARILYABANDON

4/1/2005 2 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofworkcompletion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE GTHER: Change in cmt &csg
O CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION grade

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinentdetails including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

ATTACHEDIS AN AMENDEDDHDFOR THE SUBJECT WELLDUETO CASING GRADE CHANGES, AND SURFACE PIPE
CEMENT BLENDCHANGE.

MNEPL C RY CAME REGUOL5ATORYANALYST

(This space for State use only)

RECElVED

.«*

DIVOFOlL,GAS&



d¶>SSO Producdon

Sundtv for Cement & Casina arade chanaes - DrillinaProanosis

COMPANYNAME ElPaeo Production DATE March 9, 2005
WELL NAME Brotherson #2-24B4 TD 12,75(7 MDifVD

FIELD Altamont- Bluebell COUNTY Ducheene STATE Utah
SURFACE LOCATION 1,50ŒFSL, 95f FWL, NWISW, SEC. 24, T28, R4W BHL Stralght Hole

OBJECTIVEZONE(S) GreenRiver, Wasatch

ADDITIONALINFO 13-68"SMBOPeteckand SM killlines and chokemanifold

MECHANiCAL
HOLE CASING MUD

LOGS TOPS DEPTH SIZE 812E WEIGHT

L17-1/2 13-3/8". 54.5# >55. BTc Bß-5 9 PPg

1.000 ' MDITVD J WBM

TOC @3,000' I - la 9-5/8" 40# N-80 LTC

SWD perfs i al 1

F i- I I e 4 5.000' to TD Green River @ 5,050' @4200-5831

6.200 ' MDITVD J

TOL g 10,500°

TOC @10.600'

Platform Express/Sonic/FMI

1A 5· 180 HCP-110 VamFJL 100-i30ppg
v IM

12,750



Page 2/2

DRILLINGPROGRAM

CASING PROGRAM

2,730 1,130 853,000
SURFACE 113/8 0-1000' 54 50 JS5 BTC 5 36 2.41 5 52

3,090 3 De
NTERMEDIATE S 5/6 O - 6,200' 10 J fl 0 LI( 3 5 1 06 2

13 940 13,470 153 0 1
PRODUCTIONLINER S 10.500' - 12 750' 16 HCP i 10 van FJI 2 04 1 56 2.59

I
SURFACE

Lead 800 60150Por Pmuhun+ 10% CELSeal + .25 ppe Hotels 562 100% 12.50 1.98
Tall 200 Fmam + 2mculismcMulis + .25 pps Musile 273 100% 15.80 1.17

INTERMEDIATE Lead 2,700 CBM Light 258 25% 10 50 4 10

Tail 500 50/50 Por + 0 6% Halad-322+ 5 pps GIlsonite 178 25% 14 35 1 22
+6% SalI+ 1 pps Granullie

PRODUCTIONLINER Fill 10700-12750 Prernium+5%HalacN344+35%ssA,1 130 25% 1560 156
Fill 2,050 +04%CFR-3+ 4% HR-12

Liner Lap 100

FLOAT EOUIPMENT& CENTRALizERS

SURFACE Float shoe, 1 joint,float collar. Centralize 5' above shoe &5 centralizers every thirdcoller. Thread lock FE
&bottom joint.

INTERMEDIATE Float shoe, 1 joint, float collar Centralize every 4th joint to 3000' Thread lock all FE

LINEl Float shoe, 1 joint, float collar Centralize every 4th joint to topof pay Thread
lock all FE

PRO.IECTENGINEER: Buddy Novak

DRILLINGMANAGER: Scott



STA UTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS ANDMINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER:

- ÛÛT FEE

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN,ALLØrTEE OR TRIBE NAME

7. UNITorCAAGREEMENTNAME:
00 not use u ¾rm er proposatst drmne weis, signineannydeepen mising weis talowcunentbodont-hole dagh, reenlar¢ugged wens,or¾ 96-000074

dril horizonlaNatefals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform¾r suchproposals.

i TYPE OF WELL
OILWELL GAS WELL GTHER B

TH-ER NO
24B4

2 NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER

EL PASO PRODUCTIONOIL& GAS COMPANY " 4301332695
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONENUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:

1339ELSEGUNDONE crrv ALBUQUEROUE STATE NM »,87113 (505)344-9380 ALTAMONT/BLUEBELL
4. LOCATIONOFWELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: 1500' FSL,950' FWL COUNTt DUCHESNE

GTROTR, SECHON, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:NWSW 24 28 4W STATE
UTAH

ti. CHECKAPPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE,REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O NOTICE OF WWr
AME WEN REPERFOMTE CURRENT FORMATION

<sw.m.o. > -o-a O FMCTURETRE4T SDETRACKTOREPAIRWER

^== ** O CASINGREPAIR O NEWCONSTRUCRON TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETOPREVIOUSPLANS O OPERTORCHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUWNG PLUGANDABANDON O VENTORFLARE

O SUBSEQUWF REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUGBACK WATERDISPOSAL
(sulunitoriginalFens only)

O CHANGE R STATUS PRODUCHON (STARTÆESUME) WATERSHUT•OFF
Dateof workcompletion

O COMWNGLEPRODUCMF-ORMADONS RECLAMNDONOFWERSTE OTHER, CHANGETO
O CONVERTHW RECOMPLETE-DIFFERENTFORMADON ORIGINALAPD

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly showallpertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

OPERATOR REQUESTS AUTHORIZATIONTO AMENDTHE ORIGINALDRILLINGPROGRAM TO THE FOLLOWING:

1. RUN A 20" RISER/FLOW-LINEWHILEDRILLING17.5" SURFACE HOLE FROM O'-1,000'- THEN RUNANDCEMENT
13 3/8" CASING. INSTALL13 5/8" 5M SOW - WELLHEAD.

2. NU 13 5/8" 10M STACK (SCHEMATICATTACHED). BOP CONFIGURATIONFROM 1,000'-12,750'.

NAME(PLEASEPRI CHERYLCAMERON WLE REGULATORYANALYST

SGNATU Û †ñ ¾ DKFE 3/9/2005

•••·•-• AECEIVED
MAR1 12005

DIVOFOIL,GAS&
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OSTATE OF UTAH FoRM 9

ÛÛ DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER:

FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IFINDIAN,ALLUTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do notuse this form for proposals to drillnewwells,sîgnllicantlydeepen existingwells below cunentbottom-hole depth, leenler plugged wells,or§ 96-000074

drill horizontal laterais. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLfonniorsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER BROTHERSON 2-24B4

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER

EL PASO PRODUCTIONOIL &GAS COMPANY . 4301332695
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:

1339 EL SEGUNDO NE ciTY
ALBUQUERQUE STATE NM ZIP 87113 (505) 344-9380 ALTAMONTIBLUEBELL

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1500' FSL, 950' FWL COUNTY DUCHESNE

GTROTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWSW 24 2S 4W svAm
UTAH

n. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit In Du¾W ALTERCASWG FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximale dale work wlli- O CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCHON TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBMG PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date ofworkcompletion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: WELLSPUD
3/30/2005 CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE-DIFFERENTFORMATION TIGHT HOLE

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show allpertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

MIRUPETE MARTINRATHOLERIG. DRILL24" HOLE40' DEEP. SET 20" CONDUCTOR IN5 YARDS READY-MIXCMT.
DRILLED RATHOLEANDLINED.

SPUD @ 12:00 PM ON 3/29/05.

OPERATOR REQUESTS THATA "TIBMWIMEWSTATUS BE PLACEDON THIS LOCATION. CONFIDENTALSTATUS IS
IN PLACE.

RECEIVED
APROS2005

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

NAME(PL CHERYLCAMERON y,,c, REGULATORYANALYST

SIGNATUR DATE 4/5/2005

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instruelions onReverse



STATE OF UTAH FORM 6O DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING

009
ENTITYACTIONFORM

Operator: EL PASO PRODUCTION O&G COMPANY Operator Account Number: N 1845

Address: 1339 EL SEGUNDO AVE NE

ALBUQUERQNE

state NM yp 87113 Phone Number: (505) 344-9380

Well 1

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

4301332695 BROTHERSON 2-24B4 NWSW 24 2S 4W DUCHESNE

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number EffectiveDate

B gýý j gg2 3/29/2005 L/ 7/05
Comments-

SPUD @ 12:00 PM W/ PETE MARTINRATHOLERIG. SET 40' OF 20" CONDUCTOR.

/AS 7C CUNHUUTIAL
API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Cunent Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

wellAPI
Number Well Name OG Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

comments: RECEIV ED
Ai¶06105

ACTION CODES: DN,0FOIL,GAS&MINING
A - Establish new entity for new well (single wellonly) CHERYLCAMERON

B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unit well) lease

C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity
D - Remssign well from one existing entity to a new entity n m

E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) REGU RY ANALYST 4/5/2005
Title Date



STAT OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:Û Û FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNif or CA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do notuse this¾rm¾r proposaisio drillnewwells,signincantlydeepen existingwells below cunentbottom-hole depth, reenierplugged wells,or to 96-000074

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER BROTHERSON 2-24B4

2. NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER

EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL&GAS COMPANY 4301332695
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1339 EL SEGUNDO NE CITY
ALBUQUERQUE STATE NM z,,87113 (505) 344-9380 ALTAMONTIBLUEBELL

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1500' FSL, 950'FWL coUNTY: DUCHESNE

QTR TR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDM: NWSW 24 2S 4W STATE:
UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O NOTICE OF INTW
ACIDIE DEEPB REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(Submit in Duplicale) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximate date workwillMart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCRON (STARWRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofworkcompletion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: SURFACE CSG
4/19/2005 O CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, eto

MIRUNABORS 445. DRILL12 1/4" HOLE F/40'- 1020'. RUN 13 3/8" 54.5# J-55 BTC CSG TO 1017'. PUMPED 20 BBLS
FW &20 BBLS GEL SPACERS. M&P201 BBLS/570 SX 12.5# LEADSLURRY&TAILEDWISS BBLS/260 SX 15.8#
SLURRY. DISPLACEDWI 157 BBLS FW. 38 BC RETURNS.

RECEIVED
APR22 2005

DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINING

NAME(PLEASE \¾ CHERYLCAMERON TITLE REGULATORYANALYST

SIGNATU DATE 4/20/2005

(This space for State use only)

(6/2000) (See Instructions onReverse



STAT F UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

g i i DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

7. UNITorCA AGREEMENTNAME:

Do notuse this1brmfor proposals lo drillnewwells, significantlydeepen exislingwells below cunent bottom-hole depth, reenlerplugged wells,orto 96-000074
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPUCATION R)R PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPEQFWELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER B T 2-24B4

2. NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9. APINUMBER:

EL PASO PRODUCTION OILANDGAS COMPANY 4301332695

3. ADDRESSOF0PERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1339 EL SEGUNDO NE crry ALBUQUERQUE STATE NM ZIP 87113 (505) 344-9380 ALTAMONTIBLUEBELL

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1500' FSL, 950'FWL couwry: DUCHESNE

GTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:NWSW 24 2S 4W STATE
UTAH

n. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
ACIDizE D- O REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(SubmR in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximale clateworkwillshut CASINGREPAIR O NEW CONSTRUCRON O TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISH
(SubmROriginalFormOnly)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCRON (STAMESUME) WATER SHUTOF

Date ofwork completion:
O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: INTERMEDIATE

5/3/2005 coNVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION CSG

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSEDOR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinentdetails including dates, depths, volumes, etc

CONTINUEDRLG FROM 1020'- 6000'. RIHW/ 6000' 9 5/8" 40# N-80 LTC. CMTCSG PUMPING 50 BBLS F-W AHEAD,
FOLLOWEDBY305 SX CMB LITEWl.25#SK FLOCELE &6% SALTADDED. Y-4.1 @ 10.5 PPG. TAILINWl200 SX 50/50
POZ WI2% GEL, .25/SK FLOCELE, 1#lSK GRANULITE, 5#lSK GILSONITE,5% SALT& .3%

HALAD-322ADDED. Y-1.22@
14.35 PPG. DISPLACEDCMT PUMPING 10 BBLS F-W, 424 9,4 PPG MUD&20 BBLS F-W. FULLRETURNS. EST TOC @
3000'.

RECEIVED
MAYO4 2005

Ok OFOIL,GAS&MNNG

YL C REGULATORYANALYST

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



ST OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIALNUMBER

FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IFINDIAN,ALLØTTEEORTRIBENAME

7. UNITorCA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do notuse this fann for proposals toddll new wells,signlilcantlydeepen existingwells below cunentbolIDIMiole depth, reenierplugged wells,or in 96-000074

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPUCATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLfonn forsuch proposals.

1. TYPEOFWELL 8. WELLNAMEandNUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER BROTHERSON 2-24B4

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER

EL PASO PRODUCTION OILANDGAS COMPANY " - 4301332695
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1339 EL SEGUNDO NE cn Y
ALBUQUERQUE STATE NM ZIP87113 (505) 344-9380 ALTAMONTIBLUEBELL

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOGTAGESATSURFACE: 1500' FSL, 950' FWL COUNw: DUCHESNE

GTUQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:NWSW 24 2S 4W sTAmt
UTAH

n. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
O NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximale date work willM CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Fonn Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTlON(STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwolk completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOFWELLSITE OTHER: SET LINER
6/4/2006 O CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

CONTINUEDRLG FI 10,596' - 12,500'. RUN TOTALOF 50 JTS 5" 18# HCP-110 FJL CSG &2 SHORT JTS. INSTALLED14
CENTRALIZERS 168' SPACING. TIH W/ LINERON 3 1/2" DRILLPIPE, BREAKINGCIRC EA 15 STANDS. FULL
DISPLACEMENT. TIH W/ LINERTO 12,470', FULLDISPLACEMENT. TAG BTM @ 12,500'.

TEST PUMP & LINES TO 5000 PSI. BREAKCIRC W/ 5 BBLF-W. PUMP 20 BBLSD SPACER 13.5 PPG & 130 SX
PREMAG 300 G CMTWl 35% SSA-1, 3% CFR .5% HALAD344, .3%

HR-12 ADDED@15.8 PPG, 1.56 YlELD. DISPLACE
CMTWI 111 BBLS 13.0 PPG MUD. PLUG DOWNW/ 2400 PSI. FLOATSHELD. SET ZXP PACKER. FULLRETURNS.

RECE IVED

JUNO9 2005

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINWG

NAME(PLEASEPRUT) CHERYLCAMERON TITLE REGULATORYANALYST

SIGNATU p Ì\ DATE 6/6/2005

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See instructions onReverse



ST E OF UTAH
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIALNUMBER

FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do notuse thisibrm for pmposals todrill newwells, signllicantlydeepen exislingwellsbelow cunent bolinnetole depth, reenter plugged wells, orio 96-000074

diill horizontat laterais. Use APPUCATION FOR PERMITTO DRILLfonn for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
olL WELL GAS WELL OTHER BROTHERSON 2-24B4

2. NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER

EL PASO PRODUCTION OILANDGAS COMPANY 4301332695
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1339EL SEGUNDONE cm ALBUQUERQUE STATE NM zi,87113 (505) 344-9380 ALTAMONTIBLUEBELL
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1500' FSL, 950' FWL coUNTY: DUCHESNE

GTROTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:NWSW 24 2S 4W STATE
UTAH

n. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O NOTICE OF IWW
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Appmximate dale work willM CASING REPAfR NEW CONSTRUCHON TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBMG PLUGANDABANDON O VEMTORFLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Fenn Only)

O CHANGEWELLEFATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUM WATER SHUT-OFF

Dale ofwork completlort
O COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOFWELLSITE OTHER: NEW COMPLETION

6/27/2005 O CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearty show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

THE SUBJECT WELLWAS COMPLETEDAS FOLLOWS 6/13/05 - 6/27/05:

PERFORATED 12,384'-11,777', 68 INTERVALS204 HOLES.
PERFORATED FI 11,754' - 11,605, ' 19 INTERVALS,63 HOLES, TOTALHOLES 258.

PUMP 8832 GAL PRE-FLUSH 4 ACIDSTAGES 14000 GAL3 DIVSTAGES GEL, ROCK SALT, 10500 GALFLUSH2/21192
GALKCLWTR. TOTALFLUID54524 GAL. AVG RATE29.1 BPM, MAXRATE48 BPM, AVG PRESS 5343 PSI. MAX
PRESS 5966 PSI. ISIP 4864 5 MIN,4713 10 MIN,4495 15 MIN. RD HALLIBURTON.OPEN WELLTO PIT ON 18/64
CHOKE 7:30 PM, 3200 PSI.

TURN OVER TO PRODUCTION FOR FLOW TESTING 6/23/05.

NAME(PLEA INT) CHERYLCAMERON TITLE REGULATORYANALYST

SIGNATU DATE 6/27/2005

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DN.0F0lL,GAS&



g g
STATE OF UTAH AMENDED REPORT Ü FORM 8

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES Mighlightchanges)
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING & 4.EASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

FEE
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG 96-000074
la. TYPE OF WELL: O

LL
SLL DRY OTHER 7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF WORK 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
LE /L OR EDNEEP- NETRY FSFVR.

OTHER BROTHERSON 2-24B4
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EL PASO PRODUCTION OILAND GAS COMPANY 4301332695
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

1339 EL SEGUNDO NE crry ALBUQUERQUI sure NM ze 87113 (505) 344-9380 ALTAMONT/BLUEBELL
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

MERID1AN
ATSURFACE: 1500' FSL, 950' FWL NWSW 24 2S 4W
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVALREPORTED BELOW:

12. COUNTY 13. STATE
AT TOTAL DEPTH: DUCHESNE UTAH

14. DATE SPUDDED: 15. DATE T.D. REACHED: 16. DATE COMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, GL):
3/29/2005 7/17/2005 6/23/2005 ABANDONED READYTO PRODUCE 2 6208.2 GR

18. TOTAL DEPTH: MD 12,500 19. PLUG BACKT.D.: MD 12,452 20. IF MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS, HOW MANY? * 21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD 11,575
PLUG SET:

TVD TVD TVD

22. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICALLOGS RUN (Submit copy ofeach) 23.

c TFO M EXPRESS C/,ûUE-7'/ //* WASWELLCORED? NO YES (Submitanalysis)

SONIC,4MI : pg| p
WARSEDSTRUN YES u po

24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report aH strings set in wen)

HOLE SIZE SIZEIGRADE WEIGHT (#Ift) TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) STAGEDCEMHENTER CNEOONF
S

CKES VOLSUMRE
BL) CEMENT TOP ** AMOUNT PULLED

17 1/2 (g J-55 54.5# O 1,020 1,020 FW 570
12 1/4 9 5/8 N-80 40# 1,020 6,000 6,000 LT 305

50/50 200
8 3/4 7 110 29# 6,000 10,596 10,596 M&P 235

SLRY 370

26. TUBING RECORD

SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

2 7/8 10.297
26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD

FORMATION NAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM (TVD) INTERVAL(ToplBot - MD) SIZE NO. HOLES PERFORATION STATUS

(A) WASATCH 11,ßO5 11,754 4 204 open Squeezed

(B) WASATCH 11,777 1 884 4 63 Open Squeezed

(C) Open O Sqwd

(D) Open Squeezed

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNTAND TYPE OF MATERIAL

11605-12384 8832 GAL PRE FLUSH 4 ACID STAGES 14000 GAL, 10,500 GAL FLUSH
2/21192 GAL KCL. TOTAL FLUID54524

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

O ELECTRICAUMECHANICALLOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONALSURVEY

O SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGING AND CEMENT VERIFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER: RECE IVED

(5/2000) (CONTINUED ON BACK)

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&



31. INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVALA(As shown in Item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:

7/21/2005 7/22/2005 24 RATES: * 408 419 1,067 ESP
CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GASIOIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:

12/64 225 225 1,000 RATES: -+ PROD
INTERVAL B (As shown In item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: -+

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GASIOIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

INTERVAL C (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: ->

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GASIOIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

INTERVAL D (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: -+

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GASIOIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

32. DISPOGITIONOF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

SOLD & USED FOR FUEL
33. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES (include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION (Log) MARKERS:

Show all important zones ofporosity and contentsthereof:Cored intervals and alldrill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushionused, timetoolopen, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Formation o o m Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name
(Measu Depth)

L.GREEN RIVER 8,772
WASATCH 10,534

85. ADDIRONAL REMARK: (Include plugg 4; procedure)

36. I hereby celtify that the foregoing and attached Information is complete and correct as determined from all available records.

NAME(PLEASEPRINDCHERYL CAMERON TITLE REGULATORYANALYST

SIGNATUR R AL DATE 8/8/2005

This report must be submittedwithin 30 days of
e completing or plugging a new well e teentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
e drining horizontal laterals from an existing wellbore e significantlydeepening an existingwell bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
• recompleting to a different producing formation e drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphictests

* ITEM 20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from twoor more formations.
" ITEM24: Cement Top -Show how reported top(s)of cementwere determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL),cement bond log (CBL), temperaturesurvey (TS)).

Send to: Utah Division of Oil,Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5 LEASE DESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ONWELLS
6 IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIGE NAME:

7 UNITorCA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do not use tNs ¾rm for gruposals to dBI newwels, signMcandy deepen eminingweis below current bonom-hole depHL manter plugged wels, or 10 96-000074

drBIhorizontal leierals Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILL10rmitir sudi pmposals

1 TYPE OF WELL 8 WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL O OTHER BROTHERSON 2-2484

2 NAMEOF OPERATOR: 0 API NUMBER:

EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL AND GAS COMPANY 4301332695
3 ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:

1339 EL SEGUNDO AVE NE ALBUQUERQUE NM 87113 (505) 344-9380 ALTAMONT
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: 1500' FSL, 950' FWL COUNTY: DUCHESNE

OTRIOTR.SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWSW 24 28 4W STATE:
uTAN

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICEOF INTENT
(sulimitin Dupicate) O ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT O SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate dele work windat CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION O TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK O WATERDISPOSAL
(Submit Or10InolForm Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT4)FF
Date of workcompleikxt

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER:
12/5/2005 O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show allpertinent detalis including dates, depths, volumes, ein

OPERATOR ACIDIZEDTHE SUBJECT WELL 12/2/05 AS FOLLOWS:

ACIDIZEPERFS 10,598'-12,388' WI 20,000 GAL 15% HCL USING 600 BIO BALLSAND ROCK SALT FI DIVERTER. AVG
RATE33 BPM, MAXRATE 38.1 BPM, AVGPRESS 4749 PSI, MAXPRESS 5398 PSI, NO DIVERSION. TOTAL LOAD1639
BBLS. ISIP 4600, 5 MIN4500, 10 MIN4454, 15 MIN4400.

TURNEDOVER TO PRODUCTION 12/5/05.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) CHERYLCAMERON TITLE REGULATORYANALYST

SIGNATU ÑÊ $1 ha DATE 12/19/2005

(TMs space for State use only)

RECEIVED

(5f2000) (See Instmclions on Reverse Side)
DEC2O2005

DN.0FOIL,GAS&



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET L DJJ
2. CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X Operator Name Change

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 7/1/2006

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N1845-El Paso Production O&G Company N3065-El Paso E&P Company, LP

1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX 77002 Houston, TX 77002

Phone: 1 (713) 420-2300 Phone: 1 (713) 420-2131

CA No. Unit:

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 7/5/2006

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 7/5/2006

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 3/30/2006

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 2114377-0181

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

6a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: requested 7/18/06

6b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: ok

6c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on:

7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the rnerger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM not yet BIA not yet

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: not yet

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 7/14/2006

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 7/19/2006
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 7/19/2006

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 7/19/2006
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 7/19/2006
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 7/19/2006
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: 7/5/2006

BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420

2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473

3. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JUO708

a. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a applicable wells moved

The Division sent response by letter on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 7/20/2006

COMMENTS:

El Paso 1 FORM 4A.xis



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER

MULTIPLELEASES
6 IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRlBENAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7 UNITar CA AGREEMENT MAME

Do not use thisform for proposals to dril newwells,significandydeepen emisingwallsbelow currentbosom-hole depih, menterplugged walls,or to
drBIhorizonial Islatals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLlann for such pmpoenlit

1 1YPE OF MELL 8 WELL NAMEand NUMBER.
OIL WELL GASWELL OTHER SEE ATTACHED

2 NAMEOF OPERATOR 9 API NUMBER:

EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL AND GAS COMPANY N'7Ú
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PMONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL OR WILOCAY:

1339 EL SEGUNDO AVE NE ALBUQUERQUE , NM 87113 (505) 344-9380 SEE ATTACHED
4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: SEE ATTACHED COUNTY: UINTAH& DUCHESNE

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

a CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ac.= DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
2 NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submitin Duplicale) ALTER CASING O FRACTURE TREAT O SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Appraximate dels work willstart CASNG RM NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUSPLANS OPERATOR C-E TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUGAND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUGBACK O WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS O PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Data af workcomplodon:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE O OTHER: CHANGE OF
O CONVERT WELL TYPE O RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMAFlom OPERATOR

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent delmils includinGdates, depths, volurnes, eic.

PLEASE BE ADVISED THAT EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL AND GAS COMPANY (CURRENT OPERATOR) HAS
TRANSFERRED ITS OPERATORSHIP TO EL PASO E&P COMPANY, L.P. (NEW OPERATOR) EFFECTIVE JUNE ,du

2006 AND THAT EL PASO E&P COMPANY, L.P. IS CONSIDEREDTO BE THE NEW OPERATOR OF THE
ATTACHEDWELL LOCATIONS.

EL PASO E&P COMPANY, L.P. IS RESPONSIBLE UNDER THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE LEASE(S)
FOR THE OPERATIONSCONDUCTED UPON LEASED LANDS. BOND COVERAGE IS PROVIDED BY THE STATE
OF UTAHSTATEWIDE BLANKETBOND NO. 400JUO705, BUREAU OF LANDMANAGEMENTNATIONWIDEBOND
NO. 103601420, AND BUREAU OF INDIANAFFAIRSNATIONWIDEBOND NO. 103601473.

El Paso E & P Company, L. P. gggg §
1001 Louisiana
Houston, TX 77002

William M. Griffin, Sr. Vi President

NAME(P ASEPRINT) CHERYL CAMERON y,,, AUTHORIZED REGULATORY



O
STATEOF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

Fee
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use thisform for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such pmposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Brotherson 2-24B4

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EL PASO E&P COMPANY, L.P. 4301332695
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1099 18TH ST, SUITE 1900 Denver STATE CO zi,80202 (303) 291-6475 ALTAMONT
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1500' FSL, 950' FWL COUNTY: DUchesne

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERlDIAN: NWSW 24 T2S R4W STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBlNG PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Surface IVIeter

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Commingle

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The referenced well is commingled at surface meter with the Brotherson 1-24B4 API# 43-013-30229

Engineering Techachael Ove TITLENSAME(PLEASE P

DATE 7/16/2008

(This space for te use only)

RECEIVED
AUSO5 2008

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV.OFOlL,GAS&



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER:

Fee
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposais.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL / GAS WELL OTHER Brotherson 2-24B4

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EL PASO E&P COMPANY,L.P. 4301332695
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1099 18TH ST, SUITE 1900
ciTY

Denver STATE CO ZIP 80202 (303) 291-6475 ALTAMONT
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1500' FSL, 950' FWL COUNTY: ÛUchesne

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWSW 24 T2S R4W STATE:
UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Appmximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREViOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER: COmmingle/measure
10/28/2009 O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION NO

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

THE REFERENCED WELL & BROTHERSON 1-24B4 (4301330229) SHARE THE SAME TREATER AND HAVECOMMON
ROYALTY OWNERSHIP. EACH MONTHA 24 HR. WELLTEST IS CONDUCTED FOR OIL, GAS AND WATER
PRODUCTION. THE PRODUCTIONVOLUMESARE TAKENFROM THE ORIFICE METER GAS SALES CHART, OIL
METERAND WATER METER. THE WELL NOT BEINGTESTED IS SHUT IN DURINGTHE 24 HR TEST PERIOD.
AT THIS TIME THE 1-24B4 IS TEMPORARILYABANDONED.

COPYSENTTOOPERATOR

Date:

Initials:

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) MARIEOKEEFE TITLE SR REGULATORYANALYST

SIGNATURE A s DATE 10/28/2009

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 BROTHERSON 2-24 B4 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43013326950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1500 FSL 0950 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

12/7/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 El Paso Plans to acidize. See attached procedure for detail.  

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038

TITLE
 Sr. Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 10/5/2011

10/06/2011

Oct. 05, 2011

Sundry Number: 19207 API Well Number: 43013326950000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well BROTHERSON 2-24 B4

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP 43013326950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 E×t ALTAMONT

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1500 FSL 0950 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.05 Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

12/7/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

El Paso Plans to acidize. See attached procedure for detail.

Approved by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: 10/06/2 1

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Sr. Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



Brotherson 2-24B4 Procedure Summary 

• POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing 

• Circulate & Clean wellbore 

• Acidize existing perforations (10,598’-12,384’) with 45,000 gal of 15% HCL in three one 
stage down casing. 

• RIH w/ BHA, tubing, new pump, and rods. 
 

 

Oct. 05, 2011

Sundry Number: 19207 API Well Number: 43013326950000

Brotherson 2-24B4 Procedure Summary
• POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing
• Circulate & Clean wellbore
• Acidize existing perforations (10,598'-12,384') with 45,000 gal of 15% HCL in three one

stage down casing.
• RIH w/ BHA, tubing, new pump, and



RECEIVED: Mar. 28, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 BROTHERSON 2-24 B4 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43013326950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1500 FSL 0950 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

4 /2 /2012

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Please see attached procedure for additional information.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038

TITLE
 Principle Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 3 /28 /2012

April 04, 2012

Sundry Number: 24209 API Well Number: 43013326950000Sundry Number: 24209 API Well Number: 43013326950000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well BROTHERSON 2-24 B4

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP 43013326950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1500 FSL 0950 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

/ ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

4/2/2012
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENTREPORT DEEPEN FRACTURETREAT NEWCONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached procedure for additional information. Approved by the
Utah Division of

OFI, Gas and Mining

Date: April 04, 2012

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Principle Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 3/28/2012

RECEIVED: Mar. 28,



RECEIVED: Mar. 28, 2012

Brotherson 2-24B4 Procedure Summary 

• POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing 

• Circulate & Clean wellbore 

• RIH w/5” CIBP and set plug at ~10,500’. Dump 10’ cement on plug 

• Perforate new intervals in the Lower Green River from (9,191’-10,395’) 

• Acidize new perforations with 45,000 gals of 15% HCL  

• RIH w/BHA, tubing, pump, and rods 

• Clean location and resume production 

Sundry Number: 24209 API Well Number: 43013326950000Sundry Number: 24209 API Well Number: 43013326950000

Brotherson 2-24B4 Procedure Summary
• POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing
• Circulate & Clean wellbore
• RIH w/5" CIBP and set plug at ~10,500'. Dump 10' cement on plug
• Perforate new intervals in the Lower Green River from (9,191'-10,395')
• Acidize new perforations with 45,000 gals of 15% HCL
• RIH w/BHA, tubing, pump, and rods
• Clean location and resume production

RECEIVED: Mar. 28,



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2012

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N3065- El Paso E&P Company, L.P. N3850- EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX. 77002 Houston, TX. 77002

Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038 Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038

CA No. Unit: N/A

LL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/25/2012
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/25/2012
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/27/2012
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 2114377-0181
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Yes
Sb. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: N/A
Sc. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 6/25/2012
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM N/A BIA Not Received
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: N/A
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: Second Oper Chg
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/29/2012
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/29/2012
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/29/:2012
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: N/A
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JUO705
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 6/29/2012
COMMENTS:
Disposal and Injections wells willbe moved when UIC 5 is received.

El Paso.xis



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

Multiple Leases
6 IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do notuse thisform for proposals to drillnewwells,significantlydeepen existingwells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, orto
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER See Attached

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

El Paso E&P Company, L.P. Attn: Maria Gomez
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1001 Louisiana ciTY Houston STATE TX ZIP 77002 (713) 997-5038 See Attached
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See Attached COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

« CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACl( WATER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOr10inalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUC1NG FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Change of
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Name/Operator

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please be advised that El Paso E&P Company, L.P. (current Operator) has changed names to EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
(new Operator) effective June 1, 2012 and that EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is considered the new operator of the attached
well locations.

EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is responsible under the termsand conditionsof the lease(s) for the operations conducted
upon leased lands. Bond coverage is provided by the State of Utah Statewide Blanket Bond No. 400JUO705, Bureau of Land
Management Nationwide Bond No. 103601420, and Bureau of Indian Affairs Nationwide Bond No. 103601473.

Frank W. Fallerr Frank W. Falleri
Vice President Sr. Vice President
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.

NAME(PLEAS NT) Maria S. Gomez TITLE Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE

E

DATE 6/22/2012

(ThisspaceforStateuseonly) RECEIVED
D JUN2 5 2012

. . . _ gee instrucuans on Reverse sd•) Olv.0F OIL,GAS&MINING"°°bivision of Oil,Gasand Mining-
Earlenekussell, Engineering Techniclaa



El Paso E1 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E1 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

Well Well
Well Name Sec TWP RNG API Number Entity Lease Type Type Status Conf
DVVR3-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301350070 14204621118 OVV APD C
LAKEWOOD ESTATES 3-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301350127 1420H621328 OW APD C
YOUNG3-15A3 15 010S 030W 4301350122 FEE OW APD C
WHITING4-1A2 01 010S 020W 4301350424 Fee OW APD C
ELFUMSO4-34A4 34 010S 040VV 4301350720 Fee OVV APD C
YOUNG 2-281 02 020S 010W 4304751180 FEE OW APD C
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-1084 10 020S 040W 4301350712 18221 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-2684 26 020S 040W 4301350714 18432 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-24B4 24 020S 040W 4301350717 18315 Fee OW DRL C
Cook4-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301351162 18449 Fee OVV DRL C
Peterson4-22C6 22 030S 060VV 4301351163 18518 Fee OVV DRL C
LakeForkRanch4-14B4 14 020S 040VV 4301351240 99999 Fee 04V DRL C
Ahelesco4-20C6 20 030S 060VV 4301351241 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Peck3-13BS 13 020S 050VV 4301351364 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Jensen2-9C4 09 030S 040VV 4301351375 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
El Paso 3-5C4 05 030S 040W 4301351376 18563 Fee OW DRL C
ULT6-31 31 030S 020E 4304740033 FEE O\¾ LA
OBERHANSLY 2-2A1 02 010S 010W 4304740164 FEE OW LA
DWR 3-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301351433 14-20-H62-4724 OW NEW C
LakeForkRanch5-23B4 23 0208 040VV 4301360739 Fee CNV NEVV
DuchesneLand4-10C5 10 030S 050VV 4301351262 Fee OVV NEVV C
Cabinland 4-9B3 09 020S 030W 4301351374 Fee OW NEW C
Layton 4-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301351389 Fee OW NEW C
Golinski4-24BS 24 020S 050VV 4301351404 Fee OiN NE\N C
AII>a1-21C4 21 030S 040VV 4301351460 Fee 04V NEVV C
Allison4-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301351466 Fee ONV NEVV C
Seeley 4-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301351486 Fee OW NEW C
Allen4-25B5 25 020S 050VV 4301351487 Fee OVV NEVV C
Hewett 2-6C4 06 030S 040W 4301351489 Fee OW NEW C
Young2-7C4 07 030S 040VV 4301351500 Fee OVV NEVV C
Brighton 3-31A1E 31 010S 010E 4304752471 Fee OW NEW C
Hamaker3-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304752491 Fee OVV NEVV C
Bolton3-29A1E 29 010S 010E 4304752871 Fee OVV NEVV C
HORROCKS5-20A1 20 010S 010W 4301334280 17378 FEE OW OPS C
DWR 3-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301334263 17440 14-20-462-1120 OW P
DWR 3-22C6 22 030S 060W 4301334106 17298 14-20-462-1131 OW P
DWR 3-28C6 28 030S 060W 4301334264 17360 14-20-462-1323 OW P
UTE 1-7A2 07 010S 020W 4301330025 5850 14-20-462-811 OW
UTE2-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301331033 10115 14-20-H62-1118 OiN P
WLRTRIBAL2-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301331035 10250 14-20-H62-1120 OW P
CEDAR RIM 10-A-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330615 6420 14-20-H62-1128 OW P
CEDAR RIM 12A B 030S 060W 4301331173 10672 14-20-H62-1323 OW P
UTE-FEE 2-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301331123 10365 14-20-H62-1328 OW P
TAYLOR3-34C6 34 030S 060VV 4301350200 17572 1420H621329 CNV P
BAKER UTE 2-34C6 34 030S 060W 4301332634 14590 14-20-H62-1329 OW P
UTE 3-35Z2 K 35 010N 020W 4301331133 10483 14-20-H62-1614 OW P
UTE 1-32Z2 32 010N 020W 4301330379 1915 14-20-H62-1702 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-33D 33 010N 020W 4301330334 1851 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTE 2-33Z2 33 010N 020W 4301331111 10451 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTETRIBAL2-34Z2 010N 020W 4301331167 10668 14-20-H62-1704 OW
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-13B4 13 020S 040W 4301334262 17439 14-20-H62-1743 OW P
Üii 1-28B4 28 020S 040VV 4301330242 1796 14-20-H62-1745 OVV P
UTE 1-34A4 34 010S 040W 4301330076 1585 14-20-H62-1774 OW P
UTE 1-36A4 36 010S 040VV 4301330069 1580 14-20-H62-1793 (MN P
UTE 1-1B4 01 020S 040W 4301330129 1700 14-20-H62-1798 OW P
UTE 1-31A2 31 010S 020VV 4301330401 1925 14-20-H62-1801 (MN P |



El Paso E2 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E2 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE1-25A3 25 010S 030VV4301330370 1920 'Wi-20-H62-1802 OVV P
UTE 2-25A3 25 010S 030W 4301331343 11361 14-20-H62-1802 OW P
UTE 1-26A3 26 OS 030W 4301330348 1890 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTE 2-26A3 26 010S 030W 4301331340 11349 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTETRIBAL4-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301350274 18009 1420H621804 OVV P C
UTE 2-35A3 35 010S 030W 4301331292 11222 14-20-H62-1804 ÖW P
UTE3-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301331365 11454 14-20-H62-1804 OIVV P
UTE 145B2 06 0208: 020VV4301330349 1895 14-20-H62-1807 O\N P
UTE 2-6B2 06 020S 020W 4301331140 11190 14-20-H62-1807 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-682 06 020S 020W 4301350273 18008 14-20-H62-1807 OW P C
POWELL 4-19A1 19 010S 010W 4301330071 8302 14-20-H62-1847 OW P
COLTHARP 1-27Z1 27 010N 010W 4301330151 4700 14-20-H62-1933 OW P
UTE 1-8A1E 08 010S 010E 4304730173 1846 14-20-H62-2147 OW P
UTETRIBE 1-31 31 010N 020VV 4301330278 4755 14-20-H62-2.421 OVV P
UTE 1-28B6X 28 020S 060W 4301330510 11165 14-20-H62-2492 OW P
RINKER 2-21B5 21 020S 050W 4301334166 17299 14-20-H62-2508 OW P
MURDOCK 2-34B5 34 020S 050W 4301331132 10456 14-20-H62-2511 OW P
LffE 1-3586 [35 0206; 060VV4301330507 2335 14-20-H62-2531 O\N P
UTE TRIBAL1-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304730829 860 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE 2-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304737831 16709 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE TRIBAL1-27A1E \27 010S 010E 4304730421 800 14-20-H62-2662 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-35A1E 35 010S 010E 4304730286 795 14-20-H62-2665 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-15A1E 15 010S 010E 4304730820 850 14-20-H62-2717 OW P
UTE TRIBAL P-3B1E 03 02 S 010E 4304730190 4536 14-20-H62-2873 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-22ATE 22 010S 010E 4304730429 810 14-20-H62-3103 OW P
BHUTE1-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301330419 10705 14-20-H62-3436 09/ P
BHUTE2-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301332790 15802 14-20-H62-3436 OV/ P
MCFARLANE 1-4D6 04 040S 060W 4301331074 10325 14-20-H62-3452 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-11D6 11 040S 060W 4301330482 6415 14-20-H62-3454 OW P
CARSON 2-36A1 36 010S 010W 4304731407 737 14-20-H62-3806 OW P
UTE 2-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301330775 9133 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
DWR 3-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301334003 17092 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
THE PERFECT "10" 1-10A1 10 010S 010W 4301330935 9461 14-20-H62-3855 OW
BADGER-SAM HU MONGUS1-15A1 15 010S 010W 4301330949 9462 14-20-H62-3860 OW P
MAXIMILLIAN-UTE14-1 14 010S 030W 4301330726 8437 14-20-H62-3868 OW P
FRED BASSETT 1-22A1 22 010S 010W 4301330781 9460 14-20-H62-3880 OW
UTETRIBAL1-30Z1 30 010N 010VV 4301330813 9405 14-20-H62-3910 OVV P
UTE LB 1-13A3 13 010S 030W 4301330894 9402 14-20-H62-3980 OW P
UTE2-22B6 22 020S 060VV 4301331444 11641 14-20-H62-4614 OVV P
UINTA QURAY 1-1A3 01 010S 030W 4301330132 5540 14-20-H62-4664 OW P
UTE 1-6D6 06 040S 060W 4301331696 12058 14-20-H62-4752 0W
UTE2-11D6 11 040S 060VV 4301350179 17667 1420H624801 OVV P
LÏÑï1-15D6 15 040S 060VV 4301330429 10958 14-20-H62-4824 OVV P
UTE2-15D6 15 040S 060W 4301334026 17193 14-20-H624824 OW
HILL3-24C6 24 030S 060VV 4301350293 18020 1420H624866 OVV P C
BARCLAYUTE 2-24C6R 24 030S 060W 4301333730 16385 14-20-H62-4866 OW P
BROTHERSON 1-2B4 |02 020S 040W 4301330062 1570 FEE OW P
BOREN 1-24A2 24 010S 020W 4301330084 5740 FEE _ 0W
FARNSWORTH 1-13BS 13 020S 050W 4301330092 1610 FEE OW P
BROADHEAD 1-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301330100 1595 FEE OW P
ASAYEJ 1-20A1 20 010S 010VV 4301330102 8304 FEE OVV P
HANSONTRUST 1-5B3 05 020S 030W 4301330109 1635 FEE OW P
ELLSO/ORTH1-8B4 08 020S 040VV 4301330112 1655 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-9B4 09 020S 040VV 4301330118 1660 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-17B4 17 020S 040VV 4301330126 1695 FEE OVV P
CHANDLER1-5B4 05 020S 040VV 4301330140 1685 FEE OVV P
HANSON1-32A3 32 010S 030VV 4301330141 1640 FEE OVV P
JESSEN 1-17A4 17 010S 040VV 4301330173 4725 FEE OVV P



El Paso E3 Company, LP. (N3065) to EP Energy E3 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

JENKINS1-1B3 01 020S 030VV 4301330175 1790 FEE O¾V P
GOODRICH 1-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301330182 1765 FEE OW P
ELLSVVORTH1-19B4 19 020S 040VV 4301330183 1760 FEE ONV P
O(TYLE1-10B3 10 020S 030VV 4301330187 1810 FEE OVV P
JOS. SMITH1-17C5 17 iO30S 050W 4301330188 5510 FEE OW
RUDY 1-11B3 11 020S 030W \43013302041820 FEE OW
CROCu(1-BB4 06 020S 040VV 4301330213 1825 FEE OVV P
HUNT1-21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301330214 1840 FEE OVV P
LAVVRENCE1-30B4 30 020S 040VV 4301330220 1845 FEE ONV P
YOUNK31-29B4 29 020S 040VV 4301330246 1791 FEE 04V P
GRIFFITHS1-33B4 33 020S 040W 4301330288 4760 FEE OW
PCrrTER1-2B5 02 020S 050VV 4301330293 1826 FEE DVV P
BRCITHERSCR41-26B4 26 020S 040VV 4301330336 1856 FEE ONV P
SADIEMBLANK1-33Z1 33 010N 010VV 4301330355 765 FEE OVV P
PCFEFER 1-24B5 24 020S 050VV 4301330356 1730 FEE O\N P
VVHITEHELAD1-22A3 22 010S: 030VV 4301330357 1885 FEE OVV P
CHASELMILLER2-1A2 01 010S 0200/ 4301330360 5830 FEE OWI P
ELDER1-13B2 13 020S 020VV 4301330366 1905 FEE OVV P
BROTHERSON 2-10B4 10 020S 040W 4301330443 1615 FEE OW P
FARNSWORTH 2-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301330470 1935 FEE OW P
TEVV1-15A3 15 010S 030VV 4301330529 1945 FEE OVV P
UTEFEE2-20C5 20 030S 050VV 4301330550 4527 FEE ONV P
FN3USTCad1-34Z1 34 010N 010VV 4301330566 885 FEE OVV P
GALLOVVAY1-18B1 18 020S 010VV 4301330575 2365 FEE OVV P
SMfTH1-31B5 31 020S 050VV 4301330577 1955 FEE OVV P
LEBEAU 1-34A1 34 010S 010W 4301330590 1440 FEE OW P
LINMAR1-19B2 19 020S 020VV 4301330600 9350 FEE O\N P
AflSSE1-28Z1 28 010N 010VV 4301330609 905 FEE ONV P
POVVELL1-21B1 21 020S 010VV 4301330621 910 FEE OVV P
HANSEN 1-24B3 24 020S 030VV 4301330629 2390 FEE OVV P
OhAAN2-4B4 04 020S 040VV 4301330645 9125 FEE OVV P
DYE 1-25Z2 25 010N 020W 4301330659 9111 FEE OW
HMARTIN 1-21Z1 21 010N 010VV 4301330707 925 FEE OVV P
JENSEN 1-29Z1 29 010N 010W 4301330725 9110 FEE OW P
CHASEL2-17A1V 17 010S 010VV 4301330732 9112 FEE OVV P
BIRCHELL 1-27A1 27 010S 010W 4301330758 940 FEE OW P
CHRISTENSEN2-8B3 08 020S 030W 4301330780 9355 FEE OW
LAMICQ2-SB2 05 020S 020W 4301330784 2302 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 2-14B4 14 020S 040W 4301330815 10450 FEE OW P
WRJRRAA'3-2A2 02 010S 020VVl4301330816 9620 FEE OVV P
HORROCKS2-20A1 V 20 010S 010W 4301330833 8301 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON2-2B4 02 020S 040W 4301330855 8420 FEE ÒV\Ï P
ELLSVVORTH2-8B4 08 020S 040VV 4301330898 2418 FEE OVV P
Òhi4N2-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301330904110045 FEE OVV P
BELCHER2-33B4 33 020S 040VV4301330907 9865 FEE OVV P
BROTHERSON 2-35B5 35 020S 050W 4301330908 9404 FEE OW
HORROCKS 2-4A1 T 04 010S 010W 4301330954 9855 FEE OW P
JENSEN2-29A5 29 010S 050VV4301330974 10040 FEE OVV P
UTE2-34A4 34 010S 040VV 4301330978 10070 FEE OVV P
CHANDLER2-5B4 05 020S 040VV 4301331000 10075 FEE OVV
BABCOCK2-1284 12 020S 040VV 4301331005 10215 FEE OW/ P
BADGER MR BOOM BOOM 2-29A1 29 010S 010W 4301331013 9463 FEE OW
BLEAJAARD2-18B4 18 020S 040VV4301331025 1566 FEE OVV P
BROADHEAD 2-32B5 32 020S 050W 4301331036 10216 FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-1684 16 0208 040W 43013Š1046 10217 FEE OW
RUST3-4B3 04 020S 030VV4301331070 1576 FEE OVV P
HANSON TRUST 2-32Äi 3i 030W 4ŠÕT331072154T ËËË ÒŸÏ P
BROTHElfSOffž-fiŠÀ 02ÕŠÏ040W 4301331078 1541 FEE OW P



El Paso E4 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E4 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HANSONTRUST2-5B3 05 020S 0309/ 4301331079 1636 FEE ONV P
BROTHERSON 2-15B4 15 020S 040W 4301331103 1771 FEE OW P
MONSEN2-27A3 27 010S 030W 4301331104 1746 FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-19B4 19 020S 040W 4301331105 1761 FEE OW P
HUNT2-;21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301331114 1839 FEE OVV P
JENKINS2-1B3 _ 01 020S 030W 4301331117 1792 FEE OW P
PCTTTER2-24BS 24 020S 050VV4301331118 1731 FEE OVV P
POVVELL2-13A2 K 13 010S 020VV 4301331120 8306 FEE OVV P
JENKINS 2-12B3 12 020S 030W 4301331121 10459 FEE OW P
MURDCK3K2-26B5 26 020S 050VV 4301331124 1531 FEE O\N P
BIRCH 3-27B5 27 020S 050W 4301331126 1783 FEE OW P
ROBB 2-2985 29 020S 050W 4301331130 10454 FEE OW P
LAKEFORK2-13B4 13 020S 040VV 4301331134 10452 FEE OVV P
DUNCAN 3-1A2 K 01 010S 020W 4301331135 10484 FEE OW P
HAJ4SON2-983 09 0208; 030VV 4301331136 10455 FEE O\N P
ELLSVIORTH2-9B4 09 0208 040VV 4301331138 10460 FEE OVV P
UTE2-31A2 31 010S 020VV 4301331139 10458 FEE OVV P
POVVELL2-19A1 K 19 010S 010VV 4301331149 8303 FEE OVV P
CEDAR RIM 8-A 22 030S 060W 4301331171 10666 FEE OW P
POTTER 2-684 06 0208 040W 4301331249 11038 FEE OW P
MILES2-1B5 Oi 020S 050W 4301331257 11062 FEE ÒW
MILES2-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301331261 11102 FEE OW P
MONSEN 2-22A3 22 010S 030W 4301331265 11098 FEE OW P
M/RK3HT2-13B5 13 020S 050VV 4301331267 11115 FEE VV P
TODD2-21A3 21 010S 030W 4301331296 11268 FEE OW P
VVElit4RT2-29B4 3Ï 020S 040VV 4301331298 11332 FEE lOVV P
YOUNG2-15A3 15 010S 030W 4301331301 11344 FEE
CHRISTENSEN2-29A4 29 010S 040VV 4301331303 11235 FEE O\N I
BLEAZARD2-28B4 28 020S 040W 4301331304 11433 FEE OW P
REARY2-17A3 17 010S 030W 4301331318 11251 FEE OW P
LAZYK2-11B3 11 020S 030VV 4301331352 11362 FEE OVV P
LAZYK 2-14B3 14 020S 030W 4301331354 11452 FEE OW
MifFTHEVVS2-13B2 13 020S 020VV 4301331357 11374 FEE OVV P
LAKEFORK 3-15B4 15 020S 040W 4301331358 11378 FEE OW
STEVENSCHM3-29A3 29 010S 030VV 4301331376 11442 FEE CAN P
MEEKS3-883 08 020S 0300/ 4301331377 11489 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH3-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301331389 11488 FEE OVV P
DUNCAN5-13A2 13 010S 020VV 4301331516 11776 FEE CNV P
CAÑL3-17C5 17 030S 050VV 4301332112 12476 FEE OiN P
BROTHERSON2-24B4 24 020S 040?! 4301332695 14652 FEE O¾V P
BCH3RERO2-15B3 15 020S 030VV 4301332755 14750 FEE ONV P
BROTHERSON2-25B4 25 020S 040W 4301332791 15044 FEE OW P
CABINLAND2-1683 16 020S 030W 4301332914 15236 FEE OW P
KATHERINE 3-29B4 29 020S 040W 4301332923 15331 FEE OW P
SHRINERS2-10C5 10 030S 050W 4301333008 15908 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON2-26B4 26 020S 040W 4301333139 17047 FEE OW P
MORTENSEN 4-32A2 32 010S 020W 4301333211 15720 FEE OV\Ï
FERRARINI 3-2784 020S 040W 4301333265 15883 FEE OW P
RHOADES2-25B5 25 020S 050W 4301333467 16046 FEE OW P
CASE2-31B4 31 020S 040VV 4301333548 16225 FEE OVV P
ANDERSON-ROWLEY 2-24B3 2_4 020S 030W 4301333616 16284 FEE P
SPROUSE BOWDEN2-18B1 18 020S 010W 4301333808 16677 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 3-11B4 11 020S 040W 4301333904 16891 FEE OW
KOFFORD2-36B5 36 020S 050VV 4301333988 17048 FEE O\N P
ALLEN 3-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301334027 17166 FEE OW
BOURNAKIS3-18B4 18 020S 040VV 4301334091 17264 FEE |3f! P
MILES3-12B5 12 020S 050VV 4301334110 17316 FEE OVV P
OWL and HAWK 2-31B5 31 020S 050W 4301334123 17388 FEE OW P



El Paso E5 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E5 Company, LP. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

OWL and°HAWK 4-17C5 17 030S 050W 4301334193 17387 FEE OW P
DVVR3-32B5 32 020S 050VV 4301334207 17371 FEE C¾V P
LAKEFORKRANCH 3-2284 22 0208 040W 4301334261 17409 FEE OW P
HANSON3-9B3 09 020S 030VI 4301350065 17570 FEE OVV P
DYE2-28A1 28 010S 010VV 4301350066 17531 FEE O\¾ P
MEEKS3-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301350069 17605 FEE ONV P
HANSC‡J4-8B3 08 020S 030VV 4301350088 17571 FEE OVV rP C
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-14B4 14 020S 040W 4301350097 17484 FEE OW P
ALLEN 3-9B4 09 020S 040W 4TÕŒ55ÏžŠ17656 FEE W
HORROCKS4-20A1 20 010S 010W 4301350155 17916 FEE OW
HURLEY2-33A1 33 010S 010VV 4301350166 17573 FEE ONV P
HUTCHINS/CHIODO3-20C5 20 030S 050W 4301350190 17541 FEE OW
ALLEN3-8B4 08 020S 0409/ 4301350192 17622 FEE OVV P
OWILandHAVVK3-10C5 10 030S 050VV 4301350193 17532 FEE OMt P
ÒWÏ.and HAWK 3-19CS 19 030S 050W 4301350201 17508 FEE OW P
EL PASO 4-29B5 29 020S 050W 4301350208 17934 FEE OW C
DONIHUE3-20C6 20 030S 060VV 4301350270 17762 FEE OVV P
FUMMSON3-5B3 05 020S 030VV 4301350275 17725 FEE 04V P C
SPRATT 3-26B5 26 020S 050W 4301350302 17668 FEE OW P
REBEL3-35B5 35 020S 050VV 4301350388 17911 FEE O¾V P C
FREEMAN 4-1684 16 020S 040W 4301350438 17935 Fee OW P
VVILSON3-36B5 36 020S 050VV 4301350439 17936 Fee ONV P C
ELPASO3-21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301350474 18123 Fee 04V P C
IORIGat-12B3 12 020S 030VV 4301350487 17981 Fee O\N P C
CONOVER3-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301350526 18122 Fee OW P C
ROVVLEY3-16B4 16 020S 040VV 4301350569 18151 Fee OVV P C
POTTS 3-1483 14 020S 030W 4301350570 18366 Fee OW P C
FN3TTER4-27B5 27 020S 050VV 4301350571 99999 Fee CNV P C
EL PASO 4-21B4 21 020S 040W 4301350572 18152 Fee OW
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-26B4 26 020S 040W 4301350707 18270 Fee OW C
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-25B4 25 020S 040W 4301350711 18220 Fee OW P C
LAKEFK)RKFLANCH4-23B4 23 020S 040VV 4301350713 18271 Fee CNV P C
LAKEFORKRANCH4-15B4 15 020S 040VV 4301350715 18314 Fee OVV P C
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-24B4 24 020S 040W 4301350716 18269 Fee OW P C
GOLINSKI1-8C4 08 030S 040?! 4301350986 18301 Fee 04V P C
JFU3BERTSON 1-1B1 01 020S 01044 4304730174 5370 FEE C4V P
TIMOTiff1-8B1E 08 020S 010E 4304730215 1910 FEE OVV P
MAGDALENEPAPADOPULOS 1-34A1E 34 010S 010E 4304730241 785 FEE OW P
NELSON1-3tA1E 31 010S 010E 4304730671 830 FEE OVV P
ROSEMARY LLOYD1-24A1E 24 010S 010E 4304730707 840 FEE OW P
HD LANDY1-30A1E O 010S 010E 4304730790 845 FEE OW P
WALKER1-14A1E 14 010S 010E 4304730805 855 FEE OW P
BOLTON2-29A1E 29 010S 010E 4304731112 900 FEE OW P
PRESCCAT1-35Z1 kÏ 010N 010VV 4304731173 1425 FEE OVV P
BISEL GURR 11-1 11 010S 010W 4304731213 8438 FEE OW
UTETRIBAL2-22A1E 22 010S 010E 4304731265 915 FEE OVV P
L. BOLTON 1-12A1 12 010S 010W 4304731295 920 FEE OW P
FOWLES1-26A1 26 010S 010W 4304731296 930 FEE OVV
BRADLEY23-1 23 010S 010W 4304731297 8435 FEE OW P
BASTIAN 1-2A1 02 010S 010W 4304731373 Ì36 ËE ÃÏ
DR LONGž-15A1Ë i 010S 010E 4Š0ÀÌ314709ŠÕŒÏ ËË ÄÏ
DMCK3N1-23Z1 23 010N 010VV 4304731479 10310 FEE O\N P
O MOON 2-26Z1 26 010N 010W 4304731480 10135 FEE OW
LILAD2-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304731797 10790 FEE OVV P
LANDY2-30A1E 30 010S 010E 4304731895 11127 FEE OVV P
VVINNP2-3B1E 03 0206: 010E 4304732321 11428 FEE OiN P
BISEL-GURR 2-11A1 11 010S 010W 4304735410 14428 FEE OW P
FLYlNGJFEE2-12A1 12 010S 010VV 4304739467 16686 FEE OVV P



El Paso E6 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E6 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HARVEST FELLOWSHIP CHURCH2-14B1 020S 010W 4304739591 16546 FEE OW P
OBERHANSLY 3-11A1 _ 010S 010W 4304739679 17937 FEE OW
DUNCAN 2-34A1 34 010S 010W 4304739944 17043 FEE OW P
BISEL GURR 4-11A1 11 010S 010W 4304739961 16791 FEE OW
KILLIAN3-12A1 12 010S: 010VV 4304740226 17761 ML39760 O\N P
WAINOCO ST 1-1ÀB 020S 010W 4304730818 1420 ML-24306-A OW
UTAH ST UTE 1-35A1 35 010S 010W 4304730182 5520 ML-25432 OW
ST/VTE 1-19A4 19 0106; 040VV 4301330322 9118 ML-27912 OiN P
FEDERAL 2-28E19E 28 OSOS 190E 4304732849 12117 UTU-0143512 OW
FEDERAL 1-28E19E 28 050S 190E 4304730175 5680 UTU143512 O\¾ P
BLANCHARD 1-3A2 03 010S 020W 4301320316 5877 FEE OW PA
WH BLANCHARD 2-3A2 03 010S 020W 4301330008 5775 FEE OW PA
YACKU 1-7A1 07 010S 010VV 4301330018 5795 FEE OVV PA
JAAAESPOVVELL3 _ 13 010S 020VV 4301330024 8305 FEE VVD PA
BASTIAN1(3-7D) 07 010S 010VV 4301330026 5800 FEE OLV PA
LAMICQ-URRUTY 1-8A2 08 010S 020W 4301330036 5975 FEE OW_ PA
BLEAJJARD1-18B4 18 020S 040VV 4301330059 11262 FEE OVV PA
OLSEN 1-27A4 27 010S 040VV 4301330064 1565 FEE OVV F%4
EVANS 1-31A4 31 010S 040W 4301330067 5330 FEE OW
HAAABLIN1-26A2 26 010S 020VV 4301330083 2305 FEE OUV _F4
HARTMAN 1-31A3 31 010S 030W 4301330093 10700 FEE OW PA
FARNSWORTH1-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301330097 5725 FEE OW A
POVVELL1-33A3 33 010S 030VV 4301330105 4526 FEE OVV 44
LOTRIDGEGATES 1-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301330117 1625 FEE OW
REMINGTON 1-34A3 34 010S 030W 4301330139 1670 FEE OW
ANDERSON 1-28A2 28 010S 020W 4301330150 5895 FEE OW
RHOADESMOON 1-35B5 35 020S 050W 4301330155 5270 FEE OW PA
JC44N 1-3B2 03 020S 020VV 4301330160 5765 FEE O\N
SMITH 14C5 06 030S 050VV 4301330163 5385 FEE OVV F44
HORRCK3KSFEE 1-3A1 03 010S 010VV 4301330171 5505 FEE OVV !¾4
VVARREN1-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301330174 9139 FEE CAV PA
JENSENFENZEL1-20C5 20 030S 050VV 4301330177 4730 FEE ONV PA
MNTilNRANCH1-13B4 13 020S 040VV 4301330180 4524 FEE OVV PA
BFKITHERSON 1-27B4 27 020S 040VV 4301330185 1775 FEE OVV PA
JENSEN 1-31AS 31 010S 050VV 4301330186 4735 FEE OVV 144
ROBERTSON 1-29A2 29 010S 020W 4301330189 4740 FEE OW Ä
VVINKLER1-28A3 28 010S 030VV 4301330191 5465 FEE ONV PA
CHENEY1-33A2 33 010S 020VV 4301330202 1750 FEE O¾V 144
J LAMICQSTATE 1-681 06 020S 010W 4301330210 5730 FEE OW PA
REESEESTATE1-10B2 10 020S 020VV 4301330215 5700 FEE OlVV I¾\
REEDER1-17B5 17 020S 050VV 4301330218 5460 FEE O\N PA
ROBERTSONUTE 1-2B2 02 020S 020W 4301330225 1710 FEE OW A
HATCH1-5B1 05 020S 010VV 4301330226 5470 FEE OVV PA
BROTHERSON1-22B4 22 020S 040VV 4301330227 5935 FEE OVV PA
ALLRED1-16A3 16 010S 030VV 4301330232 1780 FEE OVV 144
BIRCH1-35A5 35 010S 0509/ 4301330233 9116 FEE OVV 4
MARQUERITEUTE 1-882 08 020S 020W 4301330235 9122 FEE OW A
BU22I1-11B2 11 020S 020VV4301330248 6335 FEE 01N 44
SHISLER 1-3B 03 020S 010VV4301330249 5960 FEE OW A
TEW 1-1B5 01 020S 050W 4301330264 5580 FEE OW Ã
EVANSUTE 1-19B3 020S 030W 4301330265 1870 FEE OW PA
SHELL2-27A4 N 010S 1040W 4301330266 1776 FEE WD PA
DYE1-29A1 29 010S 010VV 4301330271 99990 FEE OVV 144
\/ODAUTE 1-‡C5 0.4 030S 050VV4301330283 4530 FEE 09V PA
BROTHERSON 1-28A4 010S 040W 4301330292 9114 FEE OW PA
MEAGHER 1-4B2 04 020S 020W 4301330313 8402 FEE OW PA
NORLING 1-9B1 020S 010W 4301330315 1811 FEE OW Ä
S. BROADHEAD 1-9C5 09 030S 050W 4301330316 5940 FEE OW PA



El Paso E7 Company, LP. (N3065) to EP Energy E7 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

TIh&DTHY1-09A3 09 010S 030VV 4301330321 10883 FEE 04V PA
BARRETT 1-34A5 34 010S 050W 4301330323 9115 FEE OW PA
MEAGHER TRIBAL 1-9B2 09 020S 020W 4301330325 9121 FEE OW PA
PHILLIPSUTE 1-3C5 03 030S 050W 4301330333 1816 FEE OW PA
ELLSWIORTH1-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301330351 6375 FEE ONV PA
LAVVSC‡J1-28A1 28 010S 010VV 4301330358 5915 FEE OVV PA
An ES1-23A4 23 010S 040VV 4301330375 1901 FEE OVV PA
HORROCKS1-6A1 06 010S 010W 4301330390 5675 FEE OW PA
SHRINE HOSPITAL 1-10C5 10 0308 050W 4301330393 5565 FEE OW Pi
GOODRICH 1-1882 18 020S 020VV 4301330397 5485 FEE O\N PA
SVVDPOVVELL3 13 010S 020VV 4301330478 10708 FEE VVD PA
BODRERO1-15B3 15 020S 030W 4301330565 4534 FEE OW
AkOC‡4TRIBAL1-30C4 30 030S 040VV 4301330576 2360 FEE ONV PA
DUNCAN2-9B5 09 020S 050VV 4301330719 5440 FEE ONV PA
FISHER1-16A4 16 010S 040VV 4301330737 2410 FEE ONV PA
URRUTY2-34A2 34 010S 020VV 4301330753 9117 FEE ONV PA
GiOODRICH1-24A4 24 010S 040VV 4301330760 2415 FEE 04V PA
CARLSMITH2-25A4 25 0108 040VV 4301330776 9136 FEE 04V PA
ANDERSC‡J1-A30B1 30 020S 010VV 4301330783 9137 FEE OVV PA
CADILLAC3-6A1 06 010S 010W 4301330834 6316 FEE OW PA
MCELPRANG 2-31A1 31 010S 010W 4301330836 8439 FEE OW A
REESE ESTATE 2-10B2 10 020S 020W 4301330837 2417 FEE OW
CLARK2-9A3 09 010S 030W 4301330876 2416 FEE OW PA
JENKINS3-16A3 16 010S 030VV 4301330877 9790 FEE ONV PA
CHRISTENSEN2-26AS 26 010S 050VV 4301330905 10710 FEE ONV PA
FORD2-36A5 36 010S 050VV 4301330911 9630 FEE O¾V PA
MORTENSEN 2-32A2 32 010S 02OW 4301330929 9486 FEE OW PA
M/ILKERSON 1-20Z1 20 010N 010VV 4301330942 5452 FEE ONV PA
UTE TRIBAL 2-4A3 S 04 010S 030W 4301330950 10230 FEE OW
OBERHANSLY2-31Z1 31 010N 010VV 4301330970 9262 FEE Ï>Al I¾\
MORRIS2-TA3 07 010S 030VV 4301330977 9725 FEE ONV PA
POVVELL2-08A3 08 010S 030VV4301330979 10175 FEE OVV PA
FISHER24A3 06 010S 030VV 4301330984 10110 FEE OVV PA
JACOBSEN2-12A4 2 010S 040VV 4301330985 10480 FEE OVV PA
CHENEY2-33/G 33 010S 020VV 4301331042 10313 FEE OVV PA
HANSON TRUST 2-29A3 29 010S 030W 4301331043 5306 FEE OW PA
BURTON2-15B5 15 020S 050VV 4301331044 10205 FEE OVV PA
ËÃh4NS-UTE2-1783 17 020S 030VV 4301331056 10210 FEE LDVV PA
ELLSVVORTH2-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301331090 5336 FEE 04V !%4
REMINGTON 2-34A3 34 010S 030W 4301331091 1902 FEE OW PA
VVINKLER2-28A3 28 010S 030VV 4301331109 4519 FEE O\¾ PA
TEVV2-10B5 10 020S 050VV 4301331125 1751 FEE ONV PA
LIND6WAY2-33A4 33 010S 040VV 4301331141 1756 FEE OVV PA
FIELDSTED2-28A4 28 010S 040VV 4301331293 10665 FEE OVV PA
POWELL 4-13A2 13 010S 020W 4301331336 11177 FEE GW PA
DUMP2-20A3 20 010S 030W 4301331505 11691 FEE OW PA
SMITH2X-23C7 23 0308 070VV 4301331634 12382 FEE D PA
MORTENSEN 3-32A2 32 010S 020W 4301331872 11928 FEE OW PA
TODDUSA ST 1-2B1 02 020S 010W 4304730167 99998 FEE OW PA
STATE1-7B1E 07 020S 010E 4304730180 5555 FEE OW
BACON1-10B1E 10 020S 010E 4304730881 5550 FEE ONV PA
PARIETTEDRAW 28-44 28 040S 010E 4304731408 4537 FEE OW PA
REYNOLDS2-7B1E 07 020S 010E 4304731840 4960 FEE OW PA
STATE2-35A2 35 010S 020W 4301330156 4715 ML-22874 OW PA
UTAH STATE LB 1-11B1 11 020S 010W 4304730171 5530 ML-23655 OW PA
STATE1-8A3 08 010S 030W 4301330286 5655 ML-24316 OW A
UTAHFEDERAL1-24B1 24 020S 010W 4304730220 590 ML-26079 OW PA
CEDAR RIM 15 34 030S 060W 4301330383 6395 14-20-462- 29 OW S



El Paso E8 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E8 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE TRIBAL2-24C7 24 030S 070W 4301331028 10240 14-20-H62-1135 OW S
CEDARRIM12 28 030S 060W 4301330344 6370 14-20-H62-1323 OW IS
CEDARRIM16 33 030S 060W 4301330363 6390 14-20-H62-1328 OW S
SPRING HOLLOW 2-34Z3 34 010N 030W 4301330234 5255 14-20-H62-1480 OW S
E3/ANSUTE1-17B3 17 020S 030VV 4301330274 5335 14-20-H62-1733 OVV S
UTE JENKS 2-1-B4 G 01 020S 040W 4301331197 10844 14-20-H62-1782 OW S
LffE3-12B3 12 020S 030VV 4301331379 11490 14-20-H62-1810 OVV S
UTE TRIBAL9-4B1 04 020S 010W 4301330194 5715 14-20-H62-1969 OW S
UTE TRIBAL 2-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301331424 11615 14-20-H62-2489 OW S
UTE 1-33B6 33 020S 060W 4301330441 1230 14-20-H62-2493 OW S
UTE2-22B5 22 0206; 050VV 4301331122 10453 14-:20-H62-2509 O\N S
UTE1-1881E 18 020S 010E 4304730969 9135 14-20-H62-2864 O\¾ S
LAUREN UTE 1-23A3 23 010S 030W 4301330895 9403 14-20-H62-3981 OW S
UTE 2-28B6 28 020S 060W 4301331434 116i4 14-20-H62-4622 OW S
UTE 1-27B6X 27 020S 060W 4301330517 11166 14-20-H62-4631 OW S
UTE2-27B6 27 020S 060VV 4301331449 11660 14-20-H62-4:331 ONV S
CEDAR RIM10-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330328 6365 14-20-H62-4724 OW 5
UTE 5-30A2 30 010S 020W 4301330169 5910 14-20-H62-4863 OW S
UTE TRIBAL G-1 (1-24C6) 24 030S 060W 4301330298 4533 14-20-H62-4866 OW S
UTE TRIBAL FEDERAL 1-30C5 30 030S 050W 4301330475 665 14-20-H62-4876 OW S
SMB1-10A2 10 010S 020VV 4301330012 5865 FEE OVV S
KENDALL1-12A2 12 010S 020VV 4301330013 5875 FEE ONV S
CEDARRIM2 20 030S 060VV .4301330019 6315 FEE ONV S
URRUTY 2-9A2 09 010S 020W 4301330046 5855 FEE OW S
BROTHERSON 1-14B4

J¯
ÕžÕŠ040W

4301330Ò5
1̄535 FEE OW

RUST1-4B3 04 020S 030VV 4301330063 1575 FEE OVV S
WK3NSEN1-21A3 21 010S 030VV4301330082 1590 FEE O\¾ S
BFKITHERSCRM1-10B4 10 020S 040VV 4301330110 1614 FEE ONV S
FÄRNSWORTH 1-12B5 12 020S 050W 4301330124 1645 FEE OW 5
ELLSVIORTH1-16B4 16 020S 040VV .4301330192 1735 FEE ONV S
MARSHALL1-;K)A3 20 010S 030VV 4301330193 9340 FEE OVV S
CHRISTMAN BLAND 1-31B4 31 020S 040W 4301330198 4745 FEE M S
FK)PER1-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301330217 1850 FEE O\¾ S
EUROTHERSO‡l1-24B4 24 020S 040VV 4301330229 1865 FEE OVV S
BFMITHERSCRM1-33A4 33 010S 040VV 4301330272 1680 FEE ONV S
BROTHERSON 1-23B4 23 020S 040W 4301330483 8423 FEE OW S
SMITHALBERT2-8C5 08 030S 050VV 4301330543 5495 FEE OVV S
VODAJOSEPHINE2-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301330553 5650 FEE ONV S
HANSEN1-16B3 16 020S 030VV 4301330617 9124 FEE OVV S
BFMITHERSCR41-25B4 25 020S 040VV 4301330668 9126 FEE 04V S
POWELL 2-33A3 33 010S 030W 4301330704 2400 FEE OW S
BROWN2-28B5 28 020S 050W 4301330718 9131 FEE OW
EULA-UTE1-16A1 16 010S 010VV 4301330782 8443 FEE O\N S
JESSEN 1-15A4 15 010S 040VV 4301330817 9345 FEE ONV S
REK3USTON 1-22Z1 22 010N 010VV 4301330884 936 FEE 04V S
FIELDSTED 2-27A4 27 010S 040W 4301330915 9632 FEE OW S
HANSKUTT 2-23B5 _ 23 020S 050W 4301330917 9600 FEE OW S
TIMOTHY 4-18A3 18 010S 030W 4301330940 9633 FEE OW S
BFKITHERSON2-3B4 03 020S 040VV 4301331008 10165 FEE ONV S
BROTHERSON 2-22B4 22 020S 1040W 4301331086 1782 FEE OW S
MILES2-35A4 35 010S 040W 4301331087 1966 FEE OW S
ELLSWORTH 2-17B4 17 020S 040W 4301331089 1696 FEE OW
RUST 2-36A4 36 010S 040W 4301331092 1577 FEE OW S
E\h4NS2-19B3 19 020S 030VV 4301331113 1777 FEE OiN iS
FARNSWORTH 2-12BS 12 020S 050W 4301331115 1646 FEE OW S
CHRISTENSEN 3-4B4 04 020S 040W 4301331142 10481 FEE OW Š
ROBERTSON 2-29A2 29 010S 020W ¡430133115010679 , FEE OW S
CEDAR RIM2A näiÏW 4301331172 10671 E OW S



El Paso E9 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E9 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

HARTMAN 2-31A3 31 010S 030W 4301331243 11026 FEE OW S
GOODRICH 2-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301331246 11037 FEE OW 'S
JESSEN2-:21A4 21 0106; 040VV 4301331256 11061 FEE C\N S
BROTHERSON3-23B4 23 020S 040W 4301331289 11141 FEE OW S
MYRIN FDANCH2-18B3 18 020S 030VV 4301331297 11475 FEE CAN S
BROTHERSON2-2B5 02 020S 050W 4301331302 11342 FEE OW S
DASTRUP2-30A3 30 010S 030VV 4301331320 11253 FEE 04V S
YOUNK32-30B4 30 020S 040VV 4301331366 11453 FEE ONV S
lOFK32-10B3 10 020S 030VV 4301331388 11482 FEE OVV S
WK3NSEN3-27A3 27 010S 030VV 4301331401 11686 FEE O\¾ S
HORROC‡092-5B1E 05 020S 010E 4304732409 11481 FEE CAN S
I-4RSEN1-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304730552 815 FEE OVV TA
DRYGULCH1-36A1 36 010S 0100/ 4304730569 820 FEE ONV TA



RECEIVED: May. 13, 2013

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 BROTHERSON 2-24 B4 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43013326950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1500 FSL 0950 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

5 /16 /2013

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 EP plans to perform routine operations and if necessary acidize with
7500 gals 15% HCL.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038

TITLE
 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 5 /13 /2013

May 15, 2013

Sundry Number: 37843 API Well Number: 43013326950000Sundry Number: 37843 API Well Number: 43013326950000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well BROTHERSON 2-24 B4

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY,L.P. 43013326950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1500 FSL 0950 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

/ ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

5/16/2013
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENTREPORT DEEPEN FRACTURETREAT NEWCONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EP plans to perform routine operations and if necessary acidize with Approved by the
7500 gals 15% HCL. Utah Division of

OFI, Gas and Mining

Date: May 15, 2013

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/13/2013

RECEIVED: May. 13,



RECEIVED: May. 15, 2013

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 BROTHERSON 2-24 B4 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43013326950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1500 FSL 0950 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

5 /15 /2013

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  pump change

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Drill out 5-inch CIBP @ 10,500. Acidize Lower Green River and Wasatch
perfs w/ 20,000 glns 15% HCL.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Lisa Morales 713 997-3587

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 5 /15 /2013

May 15, 2013

Sundry Number: 37930 API Well Number: 43013326950000Sundry Number: 37930 API Well Number: 43013326950000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well BROTHERSON 2-24 B4

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY,L.P. 43013326950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1500 FSL 0950 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

/ ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

5/15/2013
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENTREPORT DEEPEN FRACTURETREAT NEWCONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: pump change

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Drill out 5-inch CIBP @ 10,500. Acidize Lower Green River and Wasatch Approved by the
perfs w/ 20,000 gIns 15% HCL. Utah Division of

OFI, Gas and Mining

Date: May 15, 2013

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Lisa Morales 713 997-3587 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/15/2013

RECEIVED: May. 15,



RECEIVED: Aug. 06, 2013

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 BROTHERSON 2-24 B4 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43013326950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1500 FSL 0950 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

5 /31 /2013

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Acidized with 18920 gals of acid and drilled up CIBP @ 10504'. See
attached daily reports.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038

TITLE
 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 8 /6 /2013

September 05, 2013

Sundry Number: 41073 API Well Number: 43013326950000Sundry Number: 41073 API Well Number: 43013326950000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well BROTHERSON 2-24 B4

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY,L.P. 43013326950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1500 FSL 0950 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

5/31/2013
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Acidized with 18920 gals of acid and drilled up CIBP @ 10504'. See Accepted by the
attached daily reportS. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
September 05, 2013

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 8/6/2013

RECEIVED: Aug. 06,



RECEIVED: Aug. 06, 2013

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s) 

does (do) not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the 

possession or use of the report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this 

report or any part thereof, is solely at the user’s own risk.

CENTRAL DIVISION

ALTAMONT FIELD

 BROTHERSON 2-24B4

  BROTHERSON 2-24B4

   LOE LAND

Operation Summary Report

Sundry Number: 41073 API Well Number: 43013326950000Sundry Number: 41073 API Well Number: 43013326950000

CENTRAL DIVISION

ALTAMONT FIELD
BROTHERSON 2-24B4
BROTHERSON 2-24B4
LOE LAND

Operation Summary Report

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s)
does (do) not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the
possession or use of the report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this
report or any part thereof, is solely at the user's own risk.

RECEIVED: Aug. 06,



RECEIVED: Aug. 06, 2013

CENTRAL DIVISION

1       General

1.1       Customer Information

CENTRAL DIVISIONCompany

Representative

Address

1.2       Well Information

BROTHERSON 2-24B4Well

BROTHERSON 2-24B4SiteALTAMONT FIELDProject

Event LOE LANDMAGNA/026Rig Name/No.

Start Date 5/15/2013 End Date 6/1/2013

3/29/2005Spud Date/Time UWI 024-002-S 004-W 30

Active Datum KB @6,237.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)

Afe 

No./Description

PENDING 5/15/13 / 

2       Summary

2.1       Operation Summary

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

5/16/2013  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON RIGGING UP RIG 

FILLED OUT JSA.

 7:30  9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P RU RIG WHILE PUMPING 60 BBLS DOWN CSG

 9:00 13:00 4.00 PRDHEQ 18 P TRIED TO UNSEAT PUMP.RU 2ND HOTOILER. CONTINUED 

WORKING RODS, PUMPED 300 BBLS DOWN CSG @ 2BPM 200 

PSI, STILL UNABLE TO WORK PUMP OFF SEAT, BACKED OFF 

RODS.

13:00 15:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 42 P TOOH W/ 72-1", 118-7/8" AND 78-3/4. 6700' RODS.

15:00 17:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 18 P ND WELLHEAD NU BOP. RIG UP RIG FLOOR RELEASED TAC. 

SECURED WELL SDFN.

5/17/2013  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON WIRELINE FILLED 

OUT JSA.

 7:30 10:00 2.50 ELINE 21 P RU WIRELINE PERFORATED TBG @ 6770'. RD WIRELINE.

10:00 13:30 3.50 PRDHEQ 18 P TOOH W/ 2-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 TAC HUNG UP, TRIED TO WORK 

WHILE WAITING ON ACID.

13:30 15:00 1.50 MNTSSO 24 P PUMPED 660 GALS OF 15 % HCL ACID, DOWN TBG CHASED IT 

W/40 BBLS 2%KCL. SHUT TBG IN PUMPED 98 BBLS 2% KCL 

DOWN CSG LET SIT FOR 1 HR.

15:00 17:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 18 P WORKED TAC FREE TOOH W/ 134- JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. 

SECURED WELL SDFN.

5/18/2013  6:00  7:30 1.50 PMPNG 46 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TOOH W/ TBG 

PROPER PPE. FILLED OUT JSA

 7:30 14:00 6.50 PRDHEQ 18 P CONTINUE STRIPPING OUT OF WELL W/ 175-JTS 2 7/8 N-80, 

TAC, 4-JTS 2 7/8 N-80, 4' TBG SUB, SN, PBGA,2 JTS 2/78 N-80  

EUE TBG ,SOLID PLUG, 133-3/4",8-1 1/2 WEIGHT BARS AND 

PUMP WASED OFF FLOOR W/ HOT OILER,

14:00 18:30 4.50 PRDHEQ 18 P TALLIED AND RIH W/ 314-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. TAGGED 

SCALE @ 10224' UNABLE TO WORK BIT AND SCRAPPER THRU,  

TOOH W/ 7-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, SECURED WELL SDFN.

5/19/2013  6:00  7:30 1.50 PMPNG 46 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON PUMPING ACID. 

FILLED OUT JSA.

 7:30  8:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P RIH W/ 6 JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EOT @ 10204'.

 8:00 10:00 2.00 PMPNG 10 P PUMPED 660 BBLS ACID DOWN TBG. CHASED IT WITH 60 BBLS 

2% KCL SHUT IN TBG, WAITED FOR 1 HR.

 1July 02, 2013 at  3:28 pm OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 41073 API Well Number: 43013326950000Sundry Number: 41073 API Well Number: 43013326950000

CENTRAL DIVISION

1 General

1.1 Customer Information

Companv CENTRAL DIVISION

Representative
Address

1.2 Well Information

Well BROTHERSON 2-24B4

Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site BROTHERSON 2-24B4

Rig Name/No. MAGNA/026 Event LOE LAND

Start Date 5/15/2013 End Date 6/1/2013

Spud Date/Time 3/29/2005 UWI 024-002-5 OO4-W30

Active Datum KB @6,237.Oft (above Mean Sea Level)

Afe PENDING 5/15/13 /
No.lDescription

2 Summary

2.1 Operation Summary

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
5/16/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON RIGGING UP RIG

FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P RU RIG WHILE PUMPING 60 BBLS DOWN CSG
9:00 13:00 4.00 PRDHEQ 18 P TRIED TO UNSEAT PUMP.RU 2ND HOTOILER. CONTINUED

WORKING RODS, PUMPED 300 BBLS DOWN CSG @2BPM 200
PSI, STILL UNABLE TO WORK PUMP OFF SEAT, BACKED OFF
RODS.

13:00 15:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 42 P TOOH W/ 72-1", 118-7/8" AND 78-3/4. 6700' RODS.
15:00 17:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 18 P ND WELLHEAD NU BOP. RIG UP RIG FLOOR RELEASED TAC.

SECURED WELL SDFN.
5/17/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P CREWTRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON WIRELINE FILLED

OUT JSA.
7:30 10:00 2.50 ELINE 21 P RU WIRELINE PERFORATED TBG @ 6770'. RD WIRELINE.

10:00 13:30 3.50 PRDHEQ 18 P TOOH Wl2-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 TAC HUNG UP, TRIED TO WORK
WHILE WAITING ON ACID.

13:30 15:00 1.50 MNTSSO 24 P PUMPED 660 GALS OF 15% HCL ACID, DOWN TBG CHASED IT
Wl40 BBLS2%KCL. SHUTTBG IN PUMPED 98 BBLS2% KCL
DOWN CSG LET SIT FOR 1 HR.

15:00 17:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 18 P WORKED TAC FREE TOOH Wl134- JTS2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG.
SECURED WELL SDFN.

5/18/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PMPNG 46 P CREWTRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TOOH WITBG
PROPER PPE. FILLED OUT JSA

7:30 14:00 6.50 PRDHEQ 18 P CONTINUE STRIPPING OUT OF WELL W/ 175-JTS 2 7/8 N-80,
TAC, 4-JTS 2 7/8 N-80, 4' TBG SUB, SN, PBGA,2 JTS 2/78 N-80

EUE TBG ,SOLID PLUG, 133-3/4",8-1 1/2 WEIGHT BARS AND
PUMP WASED OFF FLOOR W/ HOT OILER,

14:00 18:30 4.50 PRDHEQ 18 P TALLIED AND RIH W/ 314-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. TAGGED
SCALE @ 10224' UNABLE TO WORK BIT AND SCRAPPER THRU,
TOOH Wl7-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, SECURED WELL SDFN.

5/19/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PMPNG 46 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON PUMPING ACID.
FILLED OUT JSA.

7:30 8:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P RIH W/ 6 JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EOT @ 10204'.
8:00 10:00 2.00 PMPNG 10 P PUMPED 660 BBLSACID DOWN TBG. CHASED IT WITH 60 BBLS

2% KCL SHUT IN TBG, WAITED FOR 1 HR.

July 02, 2013 at 3:28 pm 1
RECEIVED: Aug. 06,



RECEIVED: Aug. 06, 2013

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

10:00 14:00 4.00 PRDHEQ 18 P RU POWER SWIVEL. PUMPED 360 BBLS DOWN CSG @ 4 1/2 

BPM GOT CIRCULATION, REVERSED CIRC 4 1/2 BPM RETURNING 

@ 1.5 BPM. CLEANED OUT TO LINER TOP @ 10404' CIRCULATE 

TBG CLEAN. RD POWER SWIVEL.

14:00 18:00 4.00 PRDHEQ 18 P TOOH W/ 319 JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TUBING, BIT SUB, SCRAPPER 

AND BIT.

5/20/2013  6:00  6:00 24.00 PRDHEQ 18 P NO ACTIVITY

5/21/2013  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY ON PU 3 1/2 TUBING FILLED OUT 

JSA.

 7:30 14:30 7.00 PRDHEQ 18 P TALLIED AND PU 7" HD PKR, X-OVER AND 289-JTS 3 1/2 P-110 

EUE TUBING. SET PKR @ 9135'. NU  3 1/2 FRAC VALVE.

14:30 16:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 31 P FILLED CSG W/ 162-BBLS FLUID LEVEL @ 6428'. PRESSURE 

TEST @ 1000 PSI HELD.

5/22/2013  6:00  7:30 1.50 PMPNG 46 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON PUMPING ACID. 

FILLED OUT JSA.

 7:30 10:30 3.00 PMPNG 10 P FINISHED RU ACIDIZERS. PRESS TEST LINES @ 10050 HELD. 

PUMPED 83 BBLS 2%KCL BREAK DOWN PERFS @ 1734 PSI @ 

10 BPM. ISIP 309 PSI. PUMPED 3800 GALS OF 15% HCL ACID, 

DROPPED 200 BIO BALLS, PUMPED 3800 GALS OF 15% HCL 

ACID. AVG RATE 12.7 BPM, MAX RATE 21 BPM. AVG PRESS 

5163, MAX PRESS 6290. ISIP 1550, 5 MIN 646, 10 MIN 209, 12 

MIN 0 PSI. RD ACIDIZERS.

10:30 15:30 5.00 PRDHEQ 18 P RELEASED PKR TOOH W/ 289-JTS 3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG. 

X-OVER AND PKR,

15:30 17:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 18 P PU AND TALLIED 4 1/8 BIT, BIT SUB,  4-3 1/8 DRILL COLLARS, 

X-OVER, 66-JTS 2 3/8 N-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER AND 2 JTS 2 7/8 

N-80 EUE TBG. SECURED WELL SDFN.

5/23/2013  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY ON RIGGING UP POWER SWIVEL. 

FILLED OUT JSA.

 7:30  9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 18 P

5/24/2013  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON RIH W/ TUBING 

FILLED OUT JSA.

 7:30 11:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 18 P TAGGED REMAINS OF 7" CBP@ 10461'. PUMPED 100 BBLS 

DOWN CSG GOT CIRCULATION. DRILLED ON CBP LOST 

CIRCULATION. KEEP DRILLING PUSHED PLUG TO 

10504'.STARTED PULING OVER.

11:30 14:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 18 P TOOH W/ 251-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, 66-JTS 2 3/8 EUE 

TBG,4-3 1/8 DRILL COLLARS AND 4 1/8 DRILL BIT.

14:30 18:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 18 P RIH W/ 4 1/8 BLADED MILL, BIT SUB, JUNK BASKET , X-OVER, 

70- JTS 2 3/8 N-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER AND 189- JTS 2 7/8 N-80 

EUE TBG. SECURED WELL SDFN.

5/25/2013  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETYMEETING ON RUU POWER SWIVEL 

FILEDOUT JSA.

 7:30  8:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P CONTINUED RIH W/ 61-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG TAGGED CIBP @ 

10504'

 8:00  8:00 0.00 MNTSSO 18 P RU POWER SWIVEL REVERSE W/ 260 BBLS @ 4 1/2 BPM @ 

400PSI GOT CIRCULATION. RETURNING 1 BPM. DRILLED UP CIBP 

AFTER ABOUT 3HRS LOST CIRCULATION UNABLE TO PUMP 

DOWN TBG NO PRESSURE ON CSG. CONTINUE DRILLING. FELL 

THRU SWIVELED DOWN 2-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. DIDN'T TAG 

RD POWER SWIVEL

 8:00 14:30 6.50 PRDHEQ 18 P CONTINUED RIH W/ 56-JTS TAGGED REMAINS CIBP AND FILL @ 

12390'.

14:30 17:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 18 P TOOH W/ 306-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG SECURED WELL SDFN.

5/26/2013  6:00  6:00 24.00 PRDHEQ 18 P NOACTIVITY

5/27/2013  6:00  6:00 24.00 PRDHEQ 18 P NOACTIVITY

 2July 02, 2013 at  3:28 pm OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 41073 API Well Number: 43013326950000Sundry Number: 41073 API Well Number: 43013326950000

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
10:00 14:00 4.00 PRDHEQ 18 P RU POWER SWIVEL. PUMPED 360 BBLS DOWN CSG @4 1/2

BPM GOT CIRCULATION, REVERSED CIRC4 1/2 BPM RETURNING

@ 1.5 BPM. CLEANED OUT TO LINER TOP @ 10404' CIRCULATE
TBG CLEAN. RD POWER SWIVEL.

14:00 18:00 4.00 PRDHEQ 18 P TOOH W/ 319 JTS2 7/8 N-80 EUE TUBING, BIT SUB, SCRAPPER
AND BIT.

5/20/2013 6:00 6:00 24.00 PRDHEQ 18 P NOACTIVITY

5/21/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY ON PU 3 1/2 TUBING FILLED OUT
JSA.

7:30 14:30 7.00 PRDHEQ 18 P TALLIED AND PU 7" HD PKR, X-OVERAND 289-JTS 31/2 P-110

EUE TUBING. SET PKR @ 9135'. NU 3 1/2 FRAC VALVE.
14:30 16:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 31 P FILLED CSG Wl162-BBLS FLUID LEVEL @ 6428'. PRESSURE

TEST @ 1000 PSI HELD.
5/22/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PMPNG 46 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON PUMPING ACID.

FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 10:30 3.00 PMPNG 10 P FINISHED RU ACIDIZERS. PRESS TEST LINES @ 10050 HELD.

PUMPED 83 BBLS 2%KCL BREAK DOWN PERFS @ 1734 PSI @
10 BPM. ISIP 309 PSI. PUMPED 3800 GALS OF 15% HCL ACID,
DROPPED 200 BIO BALLS, PUMPED 3800 GALS OF 15% HCL
ACID. AVG RATE 12.7 BPM, MAX RATE 21 BPM. AVG PRESS
5163, MAX PRESS 6290. ISIP 1550, 5 MIN 646, 10 MIN 209, 12
MIN O PSI. RD ACIDIZERS.

10:30 15:30 5.00 PRDHEQ 18 P RELEASED PKR TOOH Wl289-JTS 31/2 P-110 EUE TBG.
X-OVERAND PKR,

15:30 17:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 18 P PU AND TALLIED 4 1/8 BIT, BIT SUB, 4-3 1/8 DRILL COLLARS,
X-OVER, 66-JTS 2 3/8 N-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER AND 2 JTS 2 7/8
N-80 EUE TBG. SECURED WELL SDFN.

5/23/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY ON RIGGING UP POWER SWIVEL.
FILLED OUT JSA.

7:30 9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 18 P

5/24/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON RIH WI TUBING
FILLED OUT JSA.

7:30 11:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 18 P TAGGED REMAINS OF 7" CBP@ 10461'. PUMPED 100 BBLS
DOWN CSG GOT CIRCULATION. DRILLED ON CBP LOST
CIRCULATION. KEEP DRILLING PUSHED PLUG TO
10504'.STARTED PULING OVER.

11:30 14:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 18 P TOOH Wl251-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, 66-JTS2 3/8 EUE
TBG,4-3 1/8 DRILL COLLARS AND 4 1/8 DRILL BIT.

14:30 18:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 18 P RIH Wl4 1/8 BLADED MILL, BIT SUB, JUNK BASKET ,
X-OVER,

70- JTS 2 3/8 N-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER AND 189- JTS 2 7/8 N-80

EUE TBG. SECURED WELL SDFN.
5/25/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETYMEETING ON RUU POWER SWIVEL

FILEDOUT JSA.
7:30 8:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P CONTINUED RIH Wl61-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG TAGGED CIBP @

10504'
8:00 8:00 0.00 MNTSSO 18 P RU POWER SWIVEL REVERSE Wl260 BBLS @ 4 1/2 BPM @

400PSI GOT CIRCULATION. RETURNING 1 BPM. DRILLED UP CIBP
AFTER ABOUT 3HRS LOST CIRCULATION UNABLE TO PUMP
DOWN TBG NO PRESSURE ON CSG. CONTINUE DRILLING. FELL
THRU SWlVELED DOWN 2-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. DIDN'T TAG
RD POWER SWIVEL

8:00 14:30 6.50 PRDHEQ 18 P CONTINUED RIH W/56-JTSTAGGED REMAINS CIBPAND FILL@
12390'.

14:30 17:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 18 P TOOH W/ 306-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG SECURED WELL SDFN.

5/26/2013 6:00 6:00 24.00 PRDHEQ 18 P NOACTIVITY

5/27/2013 6:00 6:00 24.00 PRDHEQ 18 P NOACTIVITY

July 02, 2013 at 3:28 pm 2
RECEIVED: Aug. 06,



RECEIVED: Aug. 06, 2013

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

5/28/2013  6:00  6:00 24.00 PRDHEQ 18 P NO ACTIVITY

5/29/2013  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P CREW TRAAVEL HED SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TUBING. 

FILLED OUT JSA.

 7:30  8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P LD 2-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, X-OXER, 70-JTS 2 3/8 N-80 EUE 

TBG.X-OVER, JUNK BASKET AND MILL.

 8:30 15:30 7.00 PRDHEQ 18 P RIH W/ 5"HD PKR, 4-JTS, 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER AND 

328-JTS 3 1/2 P-110 TBG, SET PKR @ 10494'. NIPPLE UP FRAC 

VALVE

15:30 19:00 3.50 PMPNG 18 P RU PUMP TRUCKS. MIXED ACID AND CHEMICALS

19:00 20:00 1.00 PMPNG 10 P  PRESS TEST LINES @ 9200 HELD. PUMPED 80 BBLS 2%KCL  @ 

10 BPM SEEN NO PRESS.SWITCHED TO ACID. PUMPED 5000  

GALS OF 15% HCL ACID, DROPPED 200 BIO BALLS, PUMPED 

5000 GALS OF 15% HCL ACID. AVG RATE 14 BPM, MAX RATE 

18 BPM. AVG PRESS 5134, MAX PRESS 6641. ISIP 0

20:00 20:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P RELEASED PKR. SECURED WELL SDFN.

5/30/2013  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON LAYING 

DOWN TBG. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30 16:00 8.50 PRDHEQ 18 P TOOH LAYING DOWN 328 JTS 3-1/2"EUE TBG, X-OVER, 4 JTS 

2-7/8"EUE TBG & 5" PKR.

16:00 17:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P CHANGE EQUIPMENT OVER TO RIH W/ PRODUCTION TBG. SDFN

5/31/2013  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON 

HYDROTESTING TBG. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30 13:00 5.50 PRDHEQ 18 P RU HYDROTEST UNIT. TIH W/ NO/GO, SOLID PLUG, 2 JTS 

2-7/8"EUE TBG, PBGA, 2' X 2-7/8"EUE PUP JT, SEAT NIPPLE, 4' X 

2-7/8"EUE PUP JT, 4 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG, TAC & 302 JTS 

2-7/8"EUE TBG, TESTING ALL TBG ABOVE SEAT NIPPLE TO 

8500 PSI.

13:00 15:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 18 P SET TAC @ 9869' IN 25K TENSION. SN @ 10005'. EOT @ 10108'. 

ND BOP. NU WELLHEAD.

15:00 16:00 1.00 PMPNG 24 P FLUSH TBG W/ 65 BBLS 2% KCL WTR.

16:00 17:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 42 P RIH & LD 33 3/4" RODS FROM DERRICK. SDFN BECAUSE OF 

HIGH WINDS

6/1/2013  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON RIH W/ 

RODS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30 14:00 6.50 PRDHEQ 42 P RIH W/ PUMP, 11 WEIGHT RODS, 140 3/4" RODS, 112 7/8" RODS 

& 132 1" RODS, CHECKING EACH BREAK & PICKING UP & 

LAYING DOWN RODS AS NEEDED FOR ROD STAR. SPACE OUT 

W/ 4' & 2' X 1" PONY RODS & NEW POLISH ROD

14:00 15:00 1.00 PMPNG 24 P FILL TBG W/ 35 BBLS 2% KCL WTR. STROKE TEST PUMP TO 

1000 PSI

15:00 17:30 2.50 MNTSSO 18 P RD RIG SLIDE PUMPING UNIT. PWOP

 3July 02, 2013 at  3:28 pm OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 41073 API Well Number: 43013326950000Sundry Number: 41073 API Well Number: 43013326950000

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
5/28/2013 6:00 6:00 24.00 PRDHEQ 18 P NOACTIVITY

5/29/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P CREWTRAAVEL HED SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TUBING.
FILLED OUT JSA.

7:30 8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P LD 2-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, X-OXER, 70-JTS 2 3/8 N-80 EUE
TBG.X-OVER, JUNK BASKET AND MILL.

8:30 15:30 7.00 PRDHEQ 18 P RIH W/ 5"HD PKR, 4-JTS, 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER AND
328-JTS 3 1/2 P-110 TBG, SET PKR @ 10494'. NIPPLE UP FRAC
VALVE

15:30 19:00 3.50 PMPNG 18 P RU PUMP TRUCKS. MIXED ACID AND CHEMICALS
19:00 20:00 1.00 PMPNG 10 P PRESS TEST LINES @ 9200 HELD. PUMPED 80 BBLS 2%KCL @

10 BPM SEEN NO PRESS.SWITCHED TO ACID. PUMPED 5000
GALS OF 15% HCL ACID, DROPPED 200 BIO BALLS, PUMPED
5000 GALS OF 15% HCL ACID. AVG RATE 14 BPM, MAX RATE
18 BPM. AVG PRESS 5134, MAX PRESS 6641. ISIP O

20:00 20:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P RELEASED PKR. SECURED WELL SDFN.

5/30/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON LAYING
DOWN TBG. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 16:00 8.50 PRDHEQ 18 P TOOH LAYING DOWN 328 JTS 3-1/2"EUE TBG, X-OVER, 4 JTS
2-7/8"EUE TBG & 5" PKR.

16:00 17:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P CHANGE EQUIPMENT OVER TO RIH W/ PRODUCTION TBG. SDFN

5/31/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON
HYDROTESTING TBG. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 13:00 5.50 PRDHEQ 18 P RU HYDROTEST UNIT. TlH W/ NO/GO, SOLID PLUG, 2 JTS
2-7/8"EUE TBG, PBGA, 2' X 2-7/8"EUE PUP JT, SEAT NIPPLE, 4'X
2-7/8"EUE PUP JT, 4 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG, TAC & 302 JTS
2-7/8"EUE TBG, TESTING ALL TBG ABOVE SEAT NIPPLE TO
8500 PSI.

13:00 15:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 18 P SET TAC @ 9869' IN 25K TENSION. SN @ 10005'. EOT @ 10108'.
ND BOP. NU WELLHEAD.

15:00 16:00 1.00 PMPNG 24 P FLUSH TBG Wl65 BBLS 2% KCL WTR.
16:00 17:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 42 P RIH & LD 33 3/4" RODS FROM DERRICK. SDFN BECAUSE OF

HIGH WINDS
6/1/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON RIH W/

RODS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 14:00 6.50 PRDHEQ 42 P RIH W/ PUMP, 11 WEIGHT RODS, 140 3/4" RODS, 112 7/8" RODS

& 132 1" RODS, CHECKING EACH BREAK & PICKING UP &
LAYING DOWN RODSAS NEEDED FOR ROD STAR. SPACE OUT
W/ 4' & 2'X 1" PONY RODS & NEW POLISH ROD

14:00 15:00 1.00 PMPNG 24 P FILL TBG W/ 35 BBLS 2% KCL WTR. STROKE TEST PUMPTO
1000 PSI

15:00 17:30 2.50 MNTSSO 18 P RD RIG SLIDE PUMPING UNIT. PWOP

July 02, 2013 at 3:28 pm 3 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Aug. 06,
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