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14421 County Rd. 10 « Ft. Lupton, Colorado 80621 « (303) 857-9999 » FAX (303) 857-0577 * E-MAIL Permitco 1@aol.com

October 14, 2004

Division of Oil, Gas & Mmmg

- 1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 :
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Attn: Diana Whitney »
: o Re: Gasco Production Company -
Gate Canyon State #23-16-11-15
1895' FSL and 2007' FWL
.NE SW Section 16, T11S - R15E
. Duchesne County, Utah
- Lease No. ML-47067

Dear Diana,

Enclosed please find two copres of the Appllcatlon for Permit to Drlll along with the requrred drilling
program, BOP diagram, wellsite maps and diagrams. >

Ifyou should need additional mformatlon please don’t hesitate to contact me. Approved copies of the
A.P.D. should be sent to Permitco Inc. at the address shown above

Sincerely,

Venessa Langmacher
Consultant for
Gasco Production Company

cc: Gasco Production Company - Englewood, co o v 0CT 1 8 2004 ‘
Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining - Roosevelt, UT ‘
Utah State Lands - SLC, UT DIV, CF OIL, GAS & MINING

Shawn Elworthy - Roosevelt, UT



. STATE OF UTAH ' FORM 3

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING AMENDED REPORT []

(highlight changes)

001

5. MINERAL LEASE NO.: 6. SURFACE:
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL HL-47067 State
1A TYPE OF WORK: DRI LL m REENTER D DEEPEN D 7. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
N/A
B. TYPEOFWELL: OIL D GAS [X' OTHER SINGLE ZONE K:] MULTIPLE ZONE D 8. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Gate Canyon
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gasco Production Company - Gate Canyon State #23-16-11-15
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
14 Inverness Drive East, Suite #H236, Englewood, CO 80112 | 303-483-0044 —GateCanyer | An 1 Act
4, LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) g . /% 11. MQE'I;;\;)/I(:"\]I’R, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE
. : 2/ L& s / y ;
wawnce T s 1895 FSL and 2007 FWL 70 Y 03 el Sec. 16, T11S-R15E
AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONE: NE SW He.
14, DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:
Approximately 28.1 miles southwest of Myton, UT Duchesne UTAH
15. DISTANCE TO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE (FEET) 16, NUMBER OF ACRES IN LEASE: 17. NUMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:
1895' 640 40 Acres
18. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING, COMPLETED, OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:
APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET):
None 11815’ Statewide Bond No. 4127763
21. ELEVATIONS (SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATE DATE WORK WILL START: 23. ESTIMATED DURATION:
6818 GL Upon Approval 35 Days
24, PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT | SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY, YIELD, AND SLURRY WEIGHT
17-1/2" 13-3/8", H-40, 48% 320' 300 sx Premium Type 5, 15.6 ppg, 1.18 yield
12-1/4" 8-5/8", J-55, 324# 2,685' | 440 sx Hi-Lift, 11 ppg, 3.91 yield + 185 sx 10-2 RFC, 14.2 ppg, Vield 1.63
7-7/8" 4-1/2", P-110, 13.54 11,815' | 390 sx Hi-Lift, 11.5 ppg, 3.05 yield + 1550 sx 50-50 Poz, 14.1 ppg, 1.28 yield
CONEDENTIAL-TIGHTHOLE
25. ' ATTACHMENTS
VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES:
WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLING PROGRAM
EVIDENCE OF DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER D FORM 5, IF OPERATOR 1S PERSON OR COMPANY OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER
AGENT: PermitCo Inc. AGENT'S PHONE NO.: 303-857-9999
NAME (PLEASE pNT) __Venessa Langmacher me  Agentfor Gasco Production Company

/
SIGNATURE /\T\(JMO JN ){%W k.ﬂ/( pate __October 14, 2004

(This space for State\ise only}

APINUMBER ASSIGNED: 43’0) 2- 35, 1Y Approve;dph)y,\me : :ﬂ-:; E @ E ﬂ M E
, Utah Division of :
Oil, Gas and Mining

(11/2001) Date: igfsthodipm rsgSide

0CT | 8 2004

DIV OF OlL, GAS & MINING




T11S, R15EFE, S.L.B.&M.

N89'59'W — 5281.32’ (G.L.0.)

GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

Well location, GATE CANYON STATE #23—-16—11-15,

located as shown in the NE 1/4 SW 1/4 of Section
16, T11S, R15E, S.L.B.&M. Duchesne County, Utah.

BASIS OF ELEVATION

TRIANGULATION STATION (NINE) LOCATED IN THE Sw 1/4
SW 1/4 OF SECTION 1, T12S, R1SE, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN

FROM THE COWBOY BENCH QUADRANGLE, UTAH, 7.5 MINUTE
QUAD. (TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL SURVEY.
SAID ELEVATION IS MARKED AS BEING 6845 FEET.
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CONFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE

Gate Canyon State #23-16-11-15
1895' FSL and 2007' FWL

NE SW Section 16, T11S - R15E
Duchesne County, Utah

Prepared For:

Gasco Production Company

&,
&
PERMITCO INC. <
14421 County Road 10 ING
Fort Lupton, CO 80621 ,%:}
303/857-9999 N
&
‘;.eq_ih",“.
<
Copies Sent To:
 Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining - SLC, UT
1 - Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining - Roosevelt, UT RECEIVED
2 - Gasco Production Company - Englewood, CO OCT 18 2004

1 - Utah Division of State Lands - SLC, UT
1 - Shawn Elworthy - Roosevelt, UT DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING




~ Application for Permit to Drill . Q\IFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE

(asco Production Company

Gate Canyon State #23-16-11-15 . | el
1895' FSL and 2007' FWL Mineral Lease #ML-47086
NE SW Section 16, T11S - R15E DRILLING PROGRAM
Duchesne County, Utah Page 2
The proposed wellsite is located on State Surface/State Minerals.
1. Estimated Tops/Geologic Markers
The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:
KB=6828'
Formation Depth Subsea
Wasatch 3,660' +3,168'
Mesaverde 7,735' -907'
Castlegate 10,385' -3,557'
Blackhawk 10,685' -3,857'
Aberdeen 11,515 -4 687
T.D. 11,815' -4,987'

2, Estimated Depths and Names of Anticipated Water, Oil, Gas or Other Minerals Bearing

Formations.
Substance Formation Depth
Gas Wasatch 4,000-7,735'
Gas Mesaverde 7,735'-10,385'
Gas Blackhawk 10,585'-11,700'

3. Well Control Equipment & Testing Procedures

Gasco Production Company's minimum specifications for pressure control equipment are as follows:

Ram Type: 11" Hydraulic double, 5000 psi w.p.

3-7 of the Utah Division of Qil, Gas & Mining. :

The size and rating of the BOP stack is shown on the attached diagram.




Application for Permit to Drill .
Gasco Production Company

A‘}lFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE

Gate Canyon State #23-16-11-15 TRl
1895' FSL and 2007' FWL Mineral Lease #ML-47056"
NE SW Section 16, T11S - R15E DRILLING PROGRAM
Duchesne County, Utah Page 3
4, Casing Program
The proposed casing program will be as follows:
Purpose Depth Hole Size | O.D. Weight Grade | Type | New/Used
Surface 0-320' 17-1/2" | 13-3/8" 48# H-40 New
Intermediate 0-2,685' 12-1/4" 8-5/8" 324 J-55 ST&C New
Production 0-11,815' 7-7/8" 4-1/2" 13.5# P-110 | LT&C New

Casing design subject to revision based on geologic conditions encountered.

5. Cement Program
Surface Type and Amount
0-320' 300 sx Premium Type 5 mixed at 15.6 ppg, 1.18 yield.
Intermediate Type and Amount
0-2,685' Lead: 440 sx Hi-Lift mixed at 11.0 ppg, 3.91 yield.
Tail: 185 sx 10-2 RFC mixed at 14.2 ppg, 1.63 yield.
Production Type and Amount
2,685'-11,815' Lead: 390 sx Hi-Lift mixed at 11.5 ppg, 3.05 yield.
Tail: 1550 sx 50/50 Poz mixed at 14.1 ppg, 1.28 yield.

6. Drilling Fluids

The proposed circuléting mediums to be employed in drilling are as follows:

Interval Mud Type Mud Wt. Visc. F/L PH

0-225 Fresh Water 8.33 1 7
225'- 2,685' Fresh Water 8.33 1 7-8
2,685 - T.D. | Fresh Water & DAP Mud | 9.0-11.1 | 30-40 12-20 8




Application for Permit to Drill . WfIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company &

Gate Canyon State #23-16-11-15 W
1895' FSL and 2007' FWL Mineral Lease #ML-47086
NE SW Section 16, T11S - R15E - DRILLING PROGRAM
Duchesne County, Utah Page 4

1

7. Testing, Logging and Coring
The anticipated type and amount of testing, logging and coring are as follows:
a. No drill stem tests are anticipated.

b. The logging program will consist of a Schiumberger Platform Express to be run from TD to
base of surface casing.

o No cores are anticipated.

8. Anticipated Pressures and H,S

a. No H,S is expected. The maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure is 6860 psi. The
maximum bottom hole temperature is 205 degrees Fahrenheit.

9. Water Source

a. All water used for the drilling of this well will be purchased the Nebeker Water Station in
Myton, UT. Permit No. 43-1723.

10.  Other Information
a. Drilling is planned to commence immediately upon approval.
b. It is anticipated that the drilling of this well will take approximately 35 days.

c. The following seed mixture will be used unless another seed mixture is recommended by the
Utah Division of Wildlife Resources.

Species Drill Seed Rate/#’s/Acre
Siberian wheatgrass, Agropyron frailie 3
Russian wildrye, Psathyrostachys juneca 2
Indian ricegrass, Stypia hymenoides 1




Application for Permit to Drill .
Gasco Production Company

QJFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE

Gate Canyon State #23-16-11-15 T4
1895' FSL and 2007' FWL Mineral Lease #ML-47056"
NE SW Section 16, T11S - R15E DRILLING PROGRAM
Duchesne County, Utah Page 5
Species Drill Seed Rate/#’s/Acre

Crested wheatgrass, Agrophyron cristatum 2

Needle and threadgrass, Hesperostipia commata 1/2

Bluebunch wheatgrass, Pseudoroegneria spicata 2

Thickspike wheatgrass; Elymus lanceolatus 2

Alfalfa, Medicago sativa 1/2

Globe mallow, Sphaeralcea coccinea 1/4

Forage kochia, Kochi'a postrata 1/2

Winterfat, Eurotia lanata 1/4

Shadscale, Atriplexconferifolia 2

TOTAL POUNDS PER ACRE 16
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Introduction

At the request of Gasco, Inc. and the Bureau of Land Management Vernal District
Office (BLM), Grand River Institute (GRI) conducted a Class III cultural resources inventory
for Gasco, Inc. of two proposed Gate Canyon well locations (State #23-16-11-15 and Fed.
#41-19-11-16), a compressor site, and a pipeline route in Duchesne County, Utah. This
work was conducted under BLM Antiquities Permit No. 03UT-54939 and Utah Division of
State History (UDSH) Project Authorization No. U04-GB-0130bs. A files search was
conducted at BLM and through Utah Division of State History (UDSH). Field work was
performed on March 29® and 30™. A total of about 64.5 acres (BLM 54.5, State 10.0) was
inspected. The file searches, survey and report were completed by Carl E. Conner (Principal
Investigator) and Barbara J. Davenport of GRI.

The survey was done to meet requirements of the Federal Land Policy and
Management Act of 1976, the National Historic Preservation Act as amended in 1992, and
the National Environmental Policy Act (NEPA) of 1969. These laws are concerned with the
identification, evaluation, and protection of fragile, non-renewable evidences of human
activity, occupation and endeavor reflected in districts, sites, structures, artifacts, objects,
ruins, works of art, architecture, and natural features that were of importance in human
events. Such resources tend to be localized and highly sensitive to disturbance.

Location of Project Area

The study area’s discrete units lie roughly 28.0 miles south of Myton, Utah, in
Duchesne County. The proposed wells, compressor site and pipeline route are located in
T.11 S, R. 15 E., Sections 16, 23, and 24; and, T. 11 S, R. 16 E., Section 19; S.L.B.M.
(Figures 1 and 2). Table 1 provides a summary of the well locations and linear routes.

Table 1. List of well locations and linear routes.

Well Designation Linear routes Location

State # 23-16-11-15 [associated pipeline route | T. 11 S, R. 15 E., Sections 16
previously inventoried] :

Fed. #41-19-11-16 2.85 mile pipeline route T.11 S, R. 16 E,, Section 19 NE NE;
T. 11 S.,R. 15 E., Sections 23 and 24

Compressor Site [Same as above] T.11S,R. 15 E., Sections 23




Environment

The project areas are within the major geologic subdivision of the Colorado Plateau
known as the Uinta Basin Section. In Utah, this section extends from the Uinta Mountains
on the north to the Book Cliffs on the south. It is a broad downwarp into which Quaternary-
and Tertiary-age deposits were made from the surrounding mountains which include
Holocene and Pleistocene pediment deposits, and Eocene-age fluvial and lacustrine
sedimentary rocks (Rigby 1976:xi). Physiographically, the basin includes the Uinta basin in
the north portion and the Book Cliffs/Roan Plateau in the south portion.

Physiographically, the project is situated on the southern slopes of the Bad Land
Cliffs. The Bad Land Cliffs are located along the extreme northern edge of the Bookcliffs
and Roan Plateau. The Bad Land Cliffs is a steep south-facing escarpment at the southern
edge of the Uinta Basin and consists of two parts, the Upper Roan Cliffs which are Eocene
age, and the lower Book Cliffs which are Cretaceous age. This plateau backslope is
commonly named the West Tavaputs Plateau. The terrain is characterized as bench land cut
by dendritic washes, which flow seasonally. The immediate project area is drained by Gate
Canyon, Water Canyon, and Blind Canyon. These have steep walls with clay and shale
exposures, and benches of sandstone. '

Elevations in the project area range from 6400-t0-6800 fect. Vegetation is mixed
shadscale desert community and sparse pinyon-juniper woodland. Regional faunal
inhabitants include deer, antelope, elk, black bear, coyote, mountain lion, cottontails, jack
rabbits, and various raptores.

A cool, mid-latitude steppe climate prevails. Annual precipitation of this elevation
range is between 8 and 12 inches. Temperatures range from 100°F in the summer to -40°F
in January. Paleoenvironmental data are scant, but it is generally agreed that gross climatic
conditions have remained fairly constant over the last 12,000 years. However, changes in
effective moisture, and cooling-warming trends probably affected the prehistoric occupation
of the region.

Files Search

Files searches were conducted through BLM and UDSH on March 24" and March
29, Previous projects in the areas near the proposed wells and pipeline include U93BL-
205b, U03AY-100b, and U03AY-101b,s. The latter one includes the area for the proposed
pipeline to the State #23-16-11-15. Only one site, 42DC772, has been previously recorded
near the survey areas. It is located approximately 300 feet west of the proposed Gate
Canyon compressor’s 10-acre study area west boundary. The following description was
extrapolated from the original report and IMACS form:



Site 42DC772 was recorded during a survey for a building stone sale area by
H.B. Phillips (Archaeologist, U.S., BLM, Vernal District Office) under Utah Project
number U-93-BL-205(b). It was recorded as a "Pitch Acquisition" site with
ethnographic significance, and covers approximately two acres. It consists of a
dozen or more trees that exhibit intentional bark and cambium removal. Clifford
Duncan (Uintah-Ouray Ute Tribal Elder) believes that such scared trees represent
Protohistoric/Historic Ute activities. This site was field evaluated as significant and
eligible for nomination and inclusion to the National Register of Historic Places
(NRHP).

Regional archaeological studies suggest nearly continuous human occupation of
northeastern Utah for the past 12,000 years. Evidence of the Paleoindian Tradition, the
Archaic Tradition, Fremont Culture, and Protohistoric/Historic Utes has been found.
Historic records suggest occupation or use by EuroAmerican trappers, settlers, miners, and
ranchers as well. Overviews of the prehistory and history of the region are provided in the
Utah BLM Cultural Resource Series No. 11, Archaeological Inventory in the Seep Ridge
Cultural Study Tract, Uintah County, Northeastern Utah with a Regional Predictive Model
for Site Locations (Chandler and Larralde 1980).

Study Objectives

The purpose of the study was to identify and record all cuitural resources within the
~ areas of potential impact and to assess their significance and eligibility to the National
Register of Historic Places (NRHP). The statements of significance included in this report
are field assessments made in support of recommendations to the BLM and State Historic
Preservation Officer (SHPO), and the final determination of site significance is made by the
BLM in consultation with the SHPO.

Paleontological resources were also considered in the inspection. However, a final
evaluation of those resources must be provided by a paleontologist permitted by Utah.

Field Methods

A Class III, 100% pedestrian, cultural resources survey of the proposed well
locations and compressor site was made by walking a series of concentric circles around the
flagged centers to diameters of 750 feet. The related pipeline route not included within the
10-acre study plots were surveyed by walking four parallel transects spaced at 10m intervals
and centered on the flagged lines to cover corridors 100 feet wide. A total of about 64.5
acres was intensively surveyed.

Cultural resources were sought as surface exposures and were characterized as sites
or isolated finds. Sites were defined by the presence of six or more artifacts and/or
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significant feature(s) indicative of patterned human activity. Isolated finds were defined by
the presence of 1 to 5 artifacts apparently of surficial nature. Cultural resources encountered
were to be recorded to standards set by the Preservation Office of the Utah Division of State
History (UDSH).

The basic approach to the data collection was the continuous mapping of observed
artifacts and features by recording UTM coordinates NAD 83 Datum) using a Trimble Geo
XT. Site maps were created using corrected data and ARCMAP. Photographs were taken at
each site and included general views and specific artifacts or features. Field notes and photo
negatives are filed at Grand River Institute, while the photographs are submitted to the BLM
and UDSH. No artifacts were collected.

Study Findings and Management Recommendations

As expected, cultural resources were encountered during the survey. Since site
42DC772 lies outside the project area and will not be adversely affected by the proposed
construction, it was given no further consideration by this project. Two historic, Euro-
American, herder camps (42DC1679 and 42DC1680) were recorded. This portion of the
report presents a discussion of site significance evaluation, describes the sites and provides
their field evaluations. Appendix A contains the resources’ location data and the IMACS
site forms.

Site Significance

The National Historic Preservation Act of 1966 (NHPA) directs federal agencies to
ensure that federally-initiated or authorized actions do not inadvertently disturb or destroy
significant cultural resource values. Significance is a quality of cultural resource properties
that qualifies them for inclusion in the NRHP. The statements of significance included in
this report are field assessments to support recommendations to the BLM and State Historic
Preservation Officer (SHPO). The final determination of site significance is made by the
controlling agencies in consultation with the SHPO and the Keeper of the Register.

The Code of Federal Regulations was used as a guide for the in-field site evaluations.
“Titles 36 CFR 50, 36 CFR 800, and 36 CFR 64 are concerned with the concepts of
significance and (possible) historic value of cultural resources. Titles 36 CFR 65 and 36
CFR 66 provide standards for the conduct of significant and scientific data recovery
activities. Finally, Title 36 CFR 60.6 establishes the measure of significance that is critical
to the determination of a site's NRHP eligibility, which is used to assess a site's research
potential:

The quality of significance in American history, architecture, archaeology, and culture is
present in districts, sites, buildings, structures, and objects of State and local importance that
possess integrity of location, design, setting, materials, workmanship, feeling, and



association, and a) that are associated with events that have made a significant contribution
to the broad patterns of history; or b) that are associated with the lives of persons significant
‘in our past; or ¢) that embody the distinctive characteristics of a type, period, or method of
construction, or that represent the work of a master, or that possess high artistic values, or
that represent a significant and distinguishable entity whose components may lack
individual distinction; or d) that have yielded, or may be likely to yield, information
important in the prehistory or history.

Site Descriptions

Site 42DC1679 is a series of historic Euro-American, herder camps identified by
clusters of cans situated near or around sandstone clast stove bases and/or ash-stained soils.
The average elevation of the site is 6800 feet and vegetation on site is a sparse, old pinyon-
juniper woodland mixed with a shadscale community. The artifact clusters are distributed
across an area that measures approximately 150 meters (E-W) by 45 meters. Typical of
these camps are scatters of rusted cans including hole-in-top, bean, tobacco, syrup, and
coffee types. Three sandstone clast stove bases were identified which may indicate the
number of camp localities. Several of the camps had cut pieces of wood located near the
stove bases.

Evaluation and Management Recommendation
This site is unlikely to contribute additional significant information concerning the

historic occupation/use of Northeastern Utah. Accordingly, it is field evaluated as non-
significant and not eligible for listing on the National Register of Historic Places. No further -
work is recommended.

Site 42DC1680 is a single, historic Euro-American, herder camp. The average
elevation of the site is 6740 feet and vegetation on site is a sparse, old pinyon-juniper
woodland mixed with a shadscale community. The artifacts are distributed across an area
that measures approximately 50 meters (NW-SE) by 10 meters. The site consists of a
sandstone clast stove base associated with two flattened pieces of stove pipe, a cluster of
cans and a low density distribution of several others. Typical of these camps, these cans
include hole-in-top, bean, tobacco, syrup, and coffee types.

Evaluation and Management Recommendation

This site is unlikely to contribute additional significant information concerning the
historic occupation/use of Northeastern Utah. Accordingly, it is field evaluated as non-
significant and not eligible for listing on the National Register of Historic Places. No further
work is recommended.




Summary of Site Evaluations and Management Recommendations

The eligibility determination and consultation process is guided by Section 106 of the
NHPA (36 CFR 60, 63, and 800). Inventory to identify, evaluate, and mitigate potential
effects to cultural resources affected by an undertaking is the first step in the Section 106
process. BLM actions cannot be authorized until the Section 106 process is completed (36
CFR 800.3). In brief, the inventory recorded two historic herder camps. Neither were
considered significant resources and are field evaluated as not eligible for nomination to the
National Register of Historic Places. ‘Accordingly, archaeological clearance is recommended
for the proposed wells, compressor site, and pipeline.

References
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1980 Archaeological inventory in the Seep Ridge Cultural Study Tract Uintah
County, Utah. In: Utah BLM Cultural Resource Series No. 11. Bureau of
Land Management, Salt Lake City.
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Table A-1. Location data for newly recorded sites.

Site Site Type UTM Location
Number (Zone 12)

42DC1679 | Historic herder camp 564980mE; 4411980mN

42DC1680 | Historic herder camp 568395mE; 4410780mN
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Abstract

Grand River Institute conducted a Class 1II cultural resources inventory for Gasco,
Inc. of two proposed Gate Canyon well locations (State #23-16-11-15 and Fed. #41-19-11-
- 16), a compressor site, and a pipeline route in Duchesne County, Utah, under BLM
Antiquities Permit No. 03UT-54939 and Utah Division of State History (UDSH) Project
Authorization No. U04-GB-0130bs. This work was done to meet requirements of Federal
and State laws that protect cultural resources.

Files searches conducted through the BLM Vernal District Office (BLM) and
through UDSH indicated no sites were previously recorded in the project areas. Field work
was performed on the 29" and 30" of March 2004. A total of about 64.5 acres (BLM 54.5,
State 10.0) was inspected. As a result, two historic sheep camps (42DC1679 and
42DC1680) were recorded. Both were field evaluated as non-significant and not eligible for
listing on the National Register of Historic Places. Accordingly, archaeological clearance is
" recommended for the proposed wells, compressor site, and pipelines.
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Form UT-8100-3 UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR - Page 1 of 2
(December 2000) BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
‘ UTAH STATE OFFICE
Summary Report of Cultural
Resources Inspection Project No.: U04-GB-0130bs
' [GRI Project No. 2407}

1. Report Title: Class III cultural resources inventory of two proposed Gate Canyon well
locations (State #23-16-11-15 and Fed. #41-19-11-16), a compressor site, and a pipeline
route in Duchesne County, Utah
2. Report Date: 03/31/2004 3. Date(s) of Survey: 29™ - 30" March 2004
4. Development Company: Gasco, Inc.
5. Responsible Institution: BLM Vernal Office
6. Responsible Individuals Principal Investigator: Field Supervisor: Carl E. Conner
Report Author(s): Carl E. Conner
7. BLM Field Office: Vernal Field Office
8. County(ies): Duchesne
9. Fieldwork Location: T. 11 S., R. 15 E., Sections 16, 23, and 24; and, T. 11 S, R. 16 E,,
Section 19; S.L.B.M.
10. Record Search:
Location of Records Searched for BLM: BLM Vernal/UDSH Date: 03/24 and 29/2004

11. Description of Proposed Project: Two proposed Gate Canyon well locations (State #23-
16-11-15 and Fed. #41-19-11-16), a compressor site, and a pipeline route

12. Description of Examination Procedures: Class III, 100% pedestrian, cultural resources
survey of the 10-acre blocks were made by walking a series of concentric circles around the
flagged centers to diameters of 750 feet. The related linear route not included within the
10-acre study plots was surveyed by walking four parallel transects spaced at 10m intervals
and centered on the flagged line to cover a corridor 100 feet wide. A total of about 64.5
acres (BLM 54.5, State 10.0) was intensively surveyed. '



Linear Miles Intensive: | 2.85 miles
Recon/Intuitive:

Acreage Intensive: | 20 acres 10 acres
Recon/Intuitive:

14. Sites Recorded:

Revisits NR Eligible

(no IMACS form)  Not Eligible

Revisits NR Eligible

updated IMACS) Not Eligible

New NR Eligible
Recordings

Not Eligible 42DC1680 42DC1679
Total Number of 42DC1680 42DC1679
Archaeological Sites

Historic Structures

(USHS Form)

Total National Register
Eligible Sites

15. Description of Findings: (see attached report) No significant historic properties were

identified within the areas of direct impact.

16. Collection Yes No
(If Yes) Curation Facility:

17. Conclusion/Recommendations:

8100-3 Form

Clearance is recommended.

Accession Number(s):




. UTAH STATE COVER PAGE .

Must Accompany All Project Reports
Submitted to Utah SHPO

Project Name: Class III cultural resources inventory of two proposed Gate Canyon well

locations (State#23-16-11-15 ggnged. #41-19-11-16), a compressor site, and a pipeline
route in Duchesne County, Utah,»"f;; Gasco, Inc.

State Proj. No. U04-GB-0130bs

Report Date: 31 March 2004 County(ies): Uintah

Principal Investigator: Carl E. Conner Field Supervisor(s): Carl E. Conner
Records search completed at: BLM Vernal/UDSH Record search date(s): 03/24 and 29/2004
Acreage Surveyed ~ Intensive: 64.5 acres (BLM 54.5, State 10.0) Recon/Intuitive: 0 acres
7.5' Series USGS Map Reference(é): Cowboy Bench 1968

Sites Reported Count | Smithsonian Site Numbers
Archaeological Sites 0
Revisits (no inventory form update)
Revisits (updated IMACS site 0
inventory form attached)
New recordings (IMACS site 2 42DC1679, 42DC1680
inventory form attached)
Total Count of Archaeological Sites 2 42DC1679, 42DC1680
Historic Structures (USHS 106 site 0
info form attached)
Total National Register Eligible Sites 0

Checklist of Required Items
1._X Copy of the Final Report

2._X Copy of 7.5' Series USGS Map with Surveyed/Excavated Area Clearly Identified.

3. Completed IMACS Site Inventory Forms, Including
X Parts Aand B or C, X The IMACS Encoding Form,
_X_Site Sketch Map, X Photographs

_X_Copy of the appropriate 7.5' Series USGS Map w/ the Site Location Clearly Marked and Labeled with
the Smithsonian Site Number
4._X_Completed "Cover Sheet" Accompanying Final Report and Survey Materials (Please make certain all of your

checked items are attached.)
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compressor site, and a pipeline route in Duchesne County, Utah, for Gasco, Inc. Sites
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Figure 1. Project location map (1 of 2) for the Class III cultural resources inventory for
Gasco, Inc. of two proposed Gate Canyon well locations (State #23-16-11-15 and Fed. #41-
19-11-16), a compressor site, and a pipeline route in Duchesne County, Utah. Areas
inventoried are highlighted. [GRI Project No. 2407, U04-GB-130b,s]
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Figure 2. Project location map (2 of 2) for the Class III cultural resources inventory for
Gasco, Inc. of two proposed Gate Canyon well locations (State #23-16-11-15 and Fed. #41-
19-11-16), a compressor site, and a pipeline route in Duchesne County, Utah. Areas
inventoried are highlighted. [GRI Project No. 2407, U04-GB-130b,s]




Q WORKSHEET
0 0 3 PLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 10/18/2004

WELL NAME: GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15

OPERATOR: GASCO PRODUCTION

N2575

CONTACT : VENESSA LANGMACHER

PROPOSED LOCATION:

NESW 16 110s 150E
SURFACE: 1895 FSL 2007 FWL

BOTTOM: 1895 FSL 2007 FWL

DUCHESNE

WILDCAT ( 1
LEASE TYPE: 3 - State

LEASE NUMBER: ML-47067
SURFACE OWNER: 3 - State
PROPOSED FORMATION: BLKHK
COALBED METHANE WELL? NO

API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-013-32685

PHONE NUMBER: 303-857-9999

INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
Tech Review Initials
Engineering D Lél{) \l/ZZ/C‘L/
Geology '
Surface

LATITUDE: 39.85514

LONGITUDE: -110.2409

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED:

Plat
Bond: Fed[] Ind[] Stal[] Feel]
(No.” 4 {27173 )

Potash (Y/N)

Water Permit

(No. 43-1723 )
RDCC Review (Y/N)

(Date: )

A NE

Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N)

0il Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13

LOCATION AND SITING:

R649-2-3.

Unit GATE CANYON

v/ R649-3-2. General

Siting: 460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

R649-3-3. Exception

Drilling Unit
Board Cause No:

Eff Date:

Siting:

R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS :

NleoedS { A,ub///'aq‘aco
+ N
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DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

STATEMENT OF BASIS
OPERATOR: Gasco Production Company
WELL NAME & NUMBER: Gate Canyon State #23-16-11-15 .
API NUMBER: 43-013-32685

LOCATION: 1/4,1/4 NE/SW Sec: 16 TWP:_11S RNG:15 E 1895 FSL 2007 FWL

Geology/Ground Water:

Gasco has proposed 320’ of surface casing and 2,685 of intermediate casing at the proposed location. Both are
to be cemented to surface. The base of the moderately saline water is estimated to at approximately 4,.300°. A
search of Division of Water Rights records shows no water wells within a 10,000’ radius of the proposed
location. The surface formation at this location is the Green River Formation. This area can be considered a
recharee area for aquifers in the Green River Formation. The Green River Formation is made up of interbedded
sands, limestones and shales. The proposed casing and cementing program should adequately protect the
recharge area and any useable sources of ground water.

Reviewer: Brad Hill Date: 11/15/2004

Surface:

The Division Staff scheduled and conducted a presite evaluation of the surface area on November 4, 2004, to take

input and address issues regarding the construction of said location. SITLA was shown as the landowner of record

and Ed Bonner with SITLA was notified by telephone and through email prior to the Division’s visit to permit this
well. Floyd Bartlett with UDWR was also invited to attend and participated in the presite process. Bartlett provided

seed mixture for reclamation to operator, SITLA and the Division. Ed Bonner was not able to attend the presite

meeting; Bartlett did and provided seed mixture for reclamation to the operator and critical wildlife input for
DOGM. This Area was called critical value deer and elk winter range by Bartlett, but he went on to say that location

is so close to an existing roadway that the area probably isn’t utilized by wintering herds much. No drilling
stipulations were requested by UDWR.

Shawn Elworthy says they plan moving onto this well in the next two or three months, or a wintertime project.
The surface and access road was void of drainage or water issues. The reserve pit is planned for the south side of
location and mostly in cut; however, underlying shale and sandy soil combined with a nearby drainage to the south
mandates the operator to take precautions with construction of the reserve pit. A pit liner and felt pad are both
necessary to assure the integrity and confinement of the drilling fluids. The gas sales line is planned to run east off
location and tie into existing line from the Gate Canyon 31-21-11-15. No other issues were discussed during presite
visit.

Reviewer: Dennis L. Ingram Date; November 8, 2004

Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill:

1. A synthetic liner with a minimum thickness of 12 mils with a felt subliner shall be properly installed in the
reserve pit.



ON-SITE PREDRILL EVALUATION
Division of 0il, Gas and Mining

OPERATOR: Gasco Production Company

WELL NAME & NUMBER: Gate Canyon State #23-16-11-15
API NUMBER: 43-013-32685

LEASE: ML-47067 FIELD/UNIT: Wildcat

LOCATION: 1/4,1/4 NE/SW Sec: 16 TWP: 11S RNG: 15E 1895 FSL _2007 FWL
LEGAL WELL SITING: 460 F SEC. LINE; 460 F 1/4,1/4 LINE; 920 F ANOTHER WELL.
GPS COORD (UTM): X =0584921 E; Y =4411748 N SURFACE OWNER: SITLA

PARTICIPANTS
Dennis L Ingram (DOGM) Floyde Bartlett (UDWR) Shawn Elworthy (Gasco)

REGIONAL/LOCAL SETTING & TOPOGRAPHY

Proposed wellsite is located approximately 27.1 mileg south of Myton,
Utah or Highway 40 down the Wells Draw Road and Gate Canyon, then
east/southeast 1.0 +/- miles along the Wrinkles Road and immediately
south of that road. The Bad Lands Cliffs are located just north of and
along the Wrinkles road and run in an east/west fashion. This well is
on the northern portion of a large east/west bench that parallels the
Bad lLands Cliffs and north of Nine Mile Canyon. Large north/south
canyons lie south of this bench and drain southward into Nine Mile.

SURFACE USE PLAN

CURRENT SURFACE USE: Livestock grazing, mule deer & elk winter range

PROPOSED SURFACE DISTURBANCE: Operator has proposed 30 +/- feet of new
access road with location measuring 380’x 200’ plus temporary reserve
pit and soil storage stockpile outside the described area.

LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHIN A 1 MILE RADIUS: Gate Canyon 31-21

LOCATION OF PRODUCTION FACILITIES AND PIPELINES: Gas production
equipment shall remain on location with gas sales line ran east and tied
into existing sales line from the Gate Canyon 31-21.

SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL: Native cut and fill using borrowed

ANCILLARY FACILITIES: None requested.

WILL DRILLING AT THIS LOCATION GENERATE PUBLIC INTEREST OR CONCERNS?
(EXPLAIN) : DRILLING SCHEDULE SHOWS A WINTER SPUD WHICH SHOULD
ELIMINATE PUBLIC SCRUTINY FROM THE PUBLIC VISITING NINE MILE CANYON OR
THE SANDWASH ENTRANCE TO THE GREEN RIVER

WASTE MANAGEMENT PLAN:

Submitted to the division with Application to Drill




ENVIRONMENTAL PARAMETERS

AFFECTED FLOODPLAINS AND/OR WETLANDS: Drainage head just south of
location that carries run-off into Gate Canyon and eventually Nine Mile

Canyon.

FLORA/FAUNA: Vegetation is mixed shadscale desgert community with gparse
pinyon-juniper, with black sage, grass, winterfat, 4 wing saltbrush on
surface of location; critical elk and mule deer winter range, animals
not likely to concentrate in this area because of existing road use.

SOIL, TYPE AND CHARACTERISTICS: Tan fine grained sandy loam with some
clays present, underlying sandstone.

SURFACE FORMATION & CHARACTERISTICS: Green River Formation

EROSION/SEDIMENTATION/STABILITY: Active erosion, some sedimentation, no
stability problems anticipated

PALEONTOLOGICAL POTENTIAL: None observe during onsite visit

RESERVE PIT

CHARACTERISTICS: Proposed on southern side of location in cut measuring
100’x 140’'x 8’ deep with 20’ wide dikes, and having wellhead adjacent or
parallel to prevailing winds.

LINER REQUIREMENTS (Site Ranking Form attached): 25 points

SURFACE RESTORATION/RECLAMATION PLAN

According to SITLA at time of reclamation or back to original
condition, contoured and seeded.

SURFACE AGREEMENT:_ Yes

CULTURAL RESOURCES/ARCHAEOLOGY: Done and prepared by the Grand River
Institute and submitted to Sitla and DOGM

OTHER OBSERVATIONS/COMMENTS

Staked immediately south of the Wrinkles Road on broad east/west bench,
surface slopes to south but is relatively flat, just south of location
and reserve pit was the head of a deep drainage that does carry run-off
south into Gate Canyon, new pipeline just east of location that leaves
the Gate Canyon #31-21, potential shallow underlying shale layers.

ATTACHMENTS

Photos of this location were taken and placed on file.

Dennis L. Ingram November 4, 2004 10:30 AM
DOGM REPRESENTATIVE DATE/TIME




Evaluation Ranking Criteria and Ranking ge
For Reserve and Onsite Pit Liner Requirements

Site-Specific Factors

Distance to Groundwater (feet)
>200
100 to 200
75 to 100
25 to 75
<25 or recharge area

Distance to Surf. Water (feet)
>1000
300 to 1000
200 to 300
100 to 200
< 100

Distance to Nearest Municipal
Well (feet)

>5280
1320 to 5280
500 to 1320
<500

Distance to Other Wells (feet)
>1320
300 to 1320
<300

Native Soil Type
Low permeability
Mod. permeability
High permeability

Fluid Type

Air/mist

Fresh Water

TDS >5000 and <10000

TDS >10000 or Oil Base Mud Fluid
containing significant levels of
hazardous constituents

Drill Cuttings
Normal Rock
Salt or detrimental

Annual Precipitation (inches)
<10
10 to 20
>20

Affected Populations
<10
10 to 30
30 to 50
>50

Presence of Nearby Utility
Conduits

Not Present

Unknown

Present

Final Score 25

Sensitivity Level I = 20 or more; total containment is required, consider criteria for excluding pit use.

Sensitivity Level Il = 15-19; lining is discretionary.

Sensitivity Level IIl = below 15: no specific lining is required .

Ranking

10
15
20

10
15
20

10
20

10
20

10
20

10
15

20

10

15

(Level

Site Ranking

20

Sensitivity)
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Well name: 11-04 Gasco Gate Canyon St 23-16--11-15
Operator: Gasco Production Company
String type:  Surface Project ID:
43-013-32685
Location: Duchesne County
Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 75 °F

Bottom hole temperature: 79 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 320 ft

Design is based on evacuated pipe.

Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 58 ft
Burst
Max anticipated surface
pressure: 294 psi
Internal gradient: 0.081 psil/ft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 320 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)
Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:
Next setting depth: 2,685 ft
Tension is based on buoyed weight. Next mud weight: 8.400 ppg
Neutral point: 281 ft Next setting BHP: 1,172 psi
Fracture mud wt; 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 320 ft
Injection pressure 320 psi
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft°)

1 320 13.375 48.00 H-40 ST&C 320 320 12.59 30.1
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension  Tension Tension
Seq Load  Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor

1 140 740 5.299 320 1730 5.41 13 322 23.90J

Prepared  Clinton Dworshak Phone: (801) 538-5280 Date: November 18,2004
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining Salt Lake City, Utah
Remarks:

Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 320 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



11-04 Gasco Gate Canyon St 23-16--11-15

Well name:

Operator: Gasco Production Company
String type:  Intermediate

Location: Duchesne County

Project ID:
43-013-32685

Design parameters:

Minimum design factors:

Environment:

Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 75 °F
Design is based-on evacuated pipe. . Bottom hole temperature: 113 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 320 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface
Burst
Max anticipated surface
pressure: 2,363 psi
Internal gradient: 0.120 psi/ft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 2,685 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)
Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:
Next setting depth: 11,815 ft
Tension is based on buoyed weight. Next mud weight: 11.100 ppg
Neutral point: 2,350 ft Next setting BHP: 6,813 psi
Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 2,685 ft
Injection pressure 2,685 psi
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft’)

1 2685 8.625 32.00 J-55 ST&C 2685 2685 7.875 170.6
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension  Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor

1 1172 2530 2.159 2685 3930 1.46 75 372 495/

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Phone: (801) 538-5280 Date: November 18,2004
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining Salt Lake City, Utah
Remarks:

Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 2685 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



Well name: 11-04 Gasco Gate Canyon St 23-16--11-15
Operator: Gasco Production Company
String type:  Production Project ID:
43-013-32685
Location: Duchesne County
Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 11.100 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 75 °F

Bottom hole temperature: - 240 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,500 ft

Design is based on evacuated pipe.

Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 2,395 ft
Burst
Max anticipated surface
pressure: 294 psi
internal gradient: 0.552 psi/ft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 6,813 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)
Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)
Tension is based on buoyed weight.
Neutral point: 9,879 ft
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Iinternal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) () (ft) (in) (ft*)

1 11815 4.5 13.50 P-110 LT&C 11815 11815 3.795 3147
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor

1 6813 10680 1.568 6813 12410 1.82 133 338 2.53J

Prepared  Clinton Dworshak Phone: (801) 538-5280 Date: November 18,2004
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining Salt Lake City, Utah
Remarks:

Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 11815 ft, a mud weight of 11.1 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



® @
United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Utah State Office
P.0O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO:

3160
(uT-922)

October 18, 2004
Memorandum
To: Assistant District Manager Minerals, Vernal District
From: Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer

Subject: 2004 Plan of Development Gate Canyon Unit,
Duchesne County, Utah.

Pursuant to email between Diana Whitney, Division of 0il, Gas and
Mining, and Mickey Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land
Management, the following well is planned for calendar year 2004
within the Gate Canyon Unit, Duchesne County, Utah.

APl # WELL NAME LOCATION

(Proposed PZ Blackhawk)

43-013-32685 Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15 Sec 16 T11ls R15E 1895 FSL 2007 FWL

This office has no objection to permitting the well at this time.

/s/ Michael L. Coulthard

bcc: File - Gate Canyon Unit
Division of 0il Gas and Mining
Central Files
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron

MCoulthard:mc:10-18-04



[Diana Whitney - Well Clearance , |I Page 1:'

From: Ed Bonner

To: Whitney, Diana

Date: 11/24/2004 3:14:48 PM
Subject: Well Clearance

The following wells have been given cultural resource clearance by the Trust Lands Cultural Resources
Group:

Crescendo Energy, LLC
San Arroyo Unit #50

Gasco Production Company

Wilkin Ridge State 43-36-10-17

Wilkin Ridge State 24-36-10-17

Wilkin Ridge State 44-32-10-17

Gate Canyon State 12-21-11-15

Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15

State 12-32-9-19

State 42-32-9-19  (Two significant sites along access road - must be avoided)

If you have any questions regarding this matter please give me a call.

CC: Garrison, LaVonne; Hill, Brad; Hunt, Gil



State of Utah

Department of
Natural Resources

ROBERT L. MORGAN
Executive Director
Division of
Oil, Gas & Mining

MARY ANN WRIGHT
Acting Division Director

OLENE S. WALKER
Governor

GAYLE F. McCKEACHNIE
Lieutenant Governor

November 24, 2004

Gasco Production Company
14 Inverness Drive East, Suite #H236
Englewood, CO 80112

Re:  Gate Canvyon State 23-16-11-15 Well, 1895' FSL, 2007 FWL, NE SW,
Sec. 16, T. 11 South, R. 15 East, Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The AP identification number assigned to this well is 43-013-32685.

ely,
R. Baza
ss001ate Director
pab
Enclosures

cc:  Duchesne County Assessor
SITLA
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801 . . . lMl.

telephone (801) 538-5340 « facsimile (801) 359-3940 « TTY (801) 538-7458 * www.ogm.utah.gov Where ideas connect™



Operator: _Gasco Production Company

Well Name & Number Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15

API Number: 43-013-32685 -

Lease: ML-47067

Location: NE SW See._16 T. 11 South R. 15 East
Conditions of Approval

1. General

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 ef seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for Permit to Drill.

Notification Requirements
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following
actions during drilling of this well:
e 24 hours prior to cementing or testing casing
24 hours prior to testing blowout prevention equipment
24 hours prior to spudding the well
within 24 hours of any emergency changes made to the approved drilling program
prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well

The following are Division of Oil, Gas and Mining contacts and their work telephone
numbers (please leave a voice mail message if the person is not available to take the call):
e Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338
e Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284 (spud)

Reporting Requirements

All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

Compliance with the State of Utah Antiquities Act forbids disturbance of archeological,
historical, or paleontological remains. Should archeological, historical or paleontological
remains be encountered during your operations, you are required to immediately suspend
all operations and immediately inform the Trust Lands Administration and the Division
of State History of the discovery of such remains.

Compliance with the Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill outlined in
the Statement of Basis. (Copy Attached)



Page 2
API #43-013-32685
November 24, 2004

6. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns)
have not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the
“Board”). In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the
operator is requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to
analyze geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data
from surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its
analysis, and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon
which the well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate
order from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such
analysis by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.
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+ Form?9 STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING ) 6. Lease Designation and Serial Number
ML-47067
7. Indian Allottee or Tribe Name
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to resnter plugged and abandoned wells. 8. Unit or Communitization Agreement
Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT -- for such proposals Gate canyon
1. Type of Well e e s 9. Well Name and Number
Oit Gas . . . : ?
Well ‘ Well [ otrer (specity S R Gate Canyon State #23-16-11-15

2. Name of Operator 10. APl Well Number

Gasco Production Company 43-013-32685
3. Address of Operator 4. Telephone Number 11. Field and Pool, or Wildcat

8 Inverness Drive East, Suite #100, Englewood, CO 80112 303/483-0044 Gate Canyon
5. Location of Well

Footage : 1895' FSL and 2007' FWL County : Duchesne

QQ, Sec, T., R, M. . NE SW, Section 16, T11S - R15E State Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit in Duplicate) : (Submit Original Form Only)

Abandonment New Construction Abandonment * New Construction

Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing

Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans Shoot or Acidize

Conversion to Injection Shoot or Acidize Conversion to Injection Vent or Flare

Haogn

Vent or Flare Fracture Treat Water Shut-Off

Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off

Fracture Treat

HININInin
aooodn

Other

HOOOO0Od

Other Request 1 year extension of APD

Date of Work Completion

Approximate Date Work Will Start

Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs
on WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

13. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Ciearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. 1f well is directionally drilled, give subsurface
locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Gasco Production Company requests a one year extension of the subject APD until November 24, 2006.

== Approved by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

W

N nxhd“‘lll

14. | hereby certify that /the foregoing is true and correct. Consultant for

Name & Signature Sf pABHa a,lléoh@@l’w /! Title Gasco Production Company Date 10/17/05

(State Use Only)

RECEIVED
(8/90) See Instructions on Reverse Side OCT 1 9 2005

DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING



Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(this form should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

APIl: 43-013-32685

Well Name: Gate Canyon State #23-16-11-15

Location: NE SW, 1895' FSL and 2007' FWL, Section 16, T11S - R15E
Company Permit Issued to: Gasco Production Company

Date Original Permit Issued: 11/24/2004

Theundersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submitted in the previously
approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be
verified.

If location on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface
agreement been updated? Yes[_] NolX]

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location? Yes[] Nolx]

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the
permitting or operation of this proposed well? Yes[_] NolX]

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way, which could affect the proposed location? ~ Yes (1 No

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? Yes[ ] NolX]
Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
which would require a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation?  Yes[ | No

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? Yes [X] NOD

October 17, 2005
Venessa Langmacher - Permitco Inc. Date

Title: Consultant for Gasco Production Company

pECEIVED
OCT 19 2005
DIV, OF OlL, GAS & MINING



DEC 29 2005 11:23AM HP LASERJET 3200 . P-

GASGO

Energy Inc

GASCO Energy, Inc.
8 Inverness Drive East

~ Suite 100
Englewood, CO 80112
(303) 483-0044
Www . gascoenergy.com

December 29, 2005

Utah Division of Oil & Gas Mining DE 2

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210 €28 2005
Box 145801 DIV OF OIL, GAS &t

Sait Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Attn: Carol Daniels & Earlene Russell —_
7 /S RISE S-y

Y3~/ 3 32p—
Ladies,

A spud and a subsequent entity action form were sent in on the Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15, -
this well has not ever been spud. The well that was spud was the Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-
16. 1 apologize for the inconvenience that this has caused. Should you have any further questions
please don’t hesitate to call.

Sincerely,

Gasco gnergy, Inc

/mzﬂz/z/@

Beverly Walker
Engineering Technician
303-996-1835 (Direct)



N
Form 9 STATE OF UTAH R

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 6. Lease Designation and Serial Number
ML-47067
7. Indian Allottee or Tribe Name
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 8. Unit or Communitization Agreement
Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT -- for such proposals N/A
1. Type of Well 9. Well Name and Number
Oil Gas .
Well Well [ otrer (specity Gate Canyon State #23-16-11-15
2. Name of Operator 10. API Well Number
Gasco Production Company 43-013-32685
3. Address of Operator 4. Telephone Number 11. Field and Pool, or Wildcat
14 Inverness Drive East, Suite #H236, Englewood, CO 80112 303/483-0044 Gate Canyon
5. Location of Well
Footage : 1895' FSL and 2007' FWL g County : Duchesne
QQ, Sec, T, R, M. . NE SW, Sec. 16, T11S-R18E State Utah
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

Abandonment New Construction Abandonment * New Construction

Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing

ooooo

] 1 ]

] ] ]

D Change of Plans |:| Recompletion D Change of Plans Shoot or Acidize
D Conversion to Injection |:| Shoot or Acidize l:] Conversion to Injection Vent or Flare
D Fracture Treat D Vent or Flare D Fracture Treat Water Shut-Off
[] Multipte Completion [] water shut-Off [] other

[X] other Request 1 year extension of APD

Date of Work Completion

Approximate Date Work Will Start

Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs
on WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

13. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state ali pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface
locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Gasco Production Company requests a one year extension of the subject APD.

by the
Utah Division of
Ofl, Gas and Mining

cc: 1-Gasco Production Company - Englewood, CO
1 - Shawn Elworthy - Roosevelt, UT

oY SR O ol
Coie d (&
lindiziss
14. | hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct. Consultant for

Name & Signatureﬂmm Tite  Gasco Production Company Date 11/10/06

(State Use Only) R E CE\VED
L GRS & MINING

(8/90) See Instructions on Reverse Side

SVASAY



Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(this form should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

APIl: 43-013-32685

Well Name: Gate Ganyon State #23-16-11-15

Location: NE SE, 1895' FSL and 2007' FWL

Company Permit Issued to: Gasco Production Company
Date Original Permit Issued: 11/24/2004

Theundersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submitted in the previously
approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be
verified.

If location on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface
agreement been updated? Yes[] NolX]

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location? Yes[ ] Nolx]

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the
permitting or operation of this proposed well? Yes[] No[X]

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way, which could affect the proposed location? Yes [ 1 No

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? Yes[ ] No[x]
Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
which would require a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation? Yes[ ] No [x]

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? Yes[X] No[]

November 10, 2006
Tabatha Parker - Permitco Inc. Date

Title: Consultant for Gasco Production Company

RECEIVED
NOV 1 3 2006

D, OF OlL, GAS & MINING



ONLINENT
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DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

!
i

Well Name: GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15

Api No: 43-013-32685 Lease Type: STATE

Section__16 _Township__11S Range_ 1SE  County DUCHESNE

Drilling Contractor LEON ROSS DRLG RIG # 8
SPUDDED:

Date 04/25/07

Time

How DRY

Drilling will Commence:

Reported by JAKE HUFFMAN

Telephone # (435) 823-2261

Date 04/25/07 Signed CHD




HPRVET 2007 12:45 HP LASERJET 3200 p.2

STATE OF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM
Operator: G@sco Production Co Operator Account Number: | N 2575
Address: 8 Inverness Drive East, Ste 100
city Englewood
state Co zip 80112 Phone Number; _(303) 483-0044
Well 1
API Number Weil Name QQ | Sec | Twp | Rng County
4301332685 Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15 NESW] 16 118 | 15E Duchesne
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date
A Q49499 MYE 412412007 570 /07
Comments: -
spaawel B KHK=MV 2D U NFIUENTIAL
Well 2
APl Number Well Name QQ | 8ec | Twp | Rng County
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date
Comments:
Well 3 :
API Number Well Name QQ | Sec | Twp County
Action Code Curvent Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date
Comuments:
ACTION CODES:
A - Establish new ertity for new well (single well only) Beverly Walker

. Add new well to existing entity (group or unit well)

B oo Prind)

€ - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity - .
D

E

- Re-assign well from one existing enfity ta a new entity

- Other (Explain in ‘comments’ section) Engineering Tech 4{26/2007
Title Date
(o0 RECEIVED
APR 2 1 2007

DIV. OF OlL, GAS & MINING



NOTICE
Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-21 states that,

> A well is considered completed when the well has been adequately worked to be capable
of producing oil or gas or when well testing as required by the division is concluded.

> Within 30 days after the completion or plugging of a well, the following shall be filed:

Form 8, Well Completion or Recompletion Report and Log

A copy of electric and radioactivity logs, if run

A copy of drillstem test reports,

A copy of formation water analyses, porosity, permeability or fluid saturation
determinations

A copy of core analyses, and lithologic logs or sample descriptions if compiled

A copy of directional, deviation, and/or measurement-while-drilling survey for
each horizontal well

Failure to submit reports in a timely manner will result in the issuance of a Notice of Violation
by the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, and may result in the Division pursuing enforcement
action as outlined in Rule R649-10, Administrative Procedures, and Section 40-6-11 of the
Utah Code.

As of the mailing of this notice, the division has not received the required reports for

Operator: Gasco Production Company Today’s Date: 09/18/2007
Well: AP| Number: Drilling Commenced:
Federal 14-31-9-19 wer 4304736271 01/11/2007
Wilkin Ridge Fed 14-4-11-17 wer 4301333099 02/10/2007
Wilkin Ridge Fed 43-29-10-17 drig/wcr 4301333098 02/20/2007
Federal 12-1-10-18 wer 4304737646 03/21/2007
Federal 12-30-9-19 drig/wcr 4304737613 04/18/2007
Gate Cyn ST 23-16-11-15 drig/wcr 4301332685 04/25/2007
Sheep Wash Fed 14-25-9-18 wcr 4304737647 05/03/2007
Federal 32-20-9-19 drig/wcr 4304736094 05/10/2007

To avoid compliance action, required reports should be mailed within 7 business days to:
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801
If you have questions or concerns regarding this matter, please call (801) 538-5284.

cc: Well File
Compliance File



DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

STATE OF UTAH

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

ML-47067

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

NA

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Gate Canyon

1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

o wett [ GASWELL [/]  OTHER Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APl NUMBER.
Gasco Production Company 4301332685
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR. PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT.
8 Inverness Dr E, Ste 100 Englewood Co 80112 (303) 483-0044 Gate Canyon
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 1895' FSL & 2007' FWL county: Duchesne

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NESW 16 11S  15E STATE

UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

]

[T} ~omice oF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate)

Approximate date work will start:

V1 suBseQUENT REPORT
(Submit Original Form Only)

Date of work completion:

4/24/2007

Ooooooono

ACIDIZE

ALTER CASING

CASING REPAIR

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS

CHANGE TUBING

CHANGE WELL NAME

CHANGE WELL STATUS

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS

CONVERT WELL TYPE

O00O00ooag

DEEPEN

FRACTURE TREAT

NEW CONSTRUCTION
OPERATOR CHANGE

PLUG AND ABANDON

PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION (START/RESUME)
RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE

RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
TEMPORARILY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR

VENT OR FLARE

WATER DISPOSAL

WATER SHUT-OFF

NOOOOOOd

orHer: Well status update

12

DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

This well was spud on April 24, 2007. The current drilled depth of this well is 350 Drilling operations on this well have been
suspended as we are currently re-evaluating the geology after new production resuits in our Gate Canyon and Riverbend
areas. This could result in a changed TD for this well.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Beveﬂy Walker

Engineering Tech

TITLE
SIGNATURE \ B } ¢ [\( { 1 (/( )(‘}‘ (t/\ oare  10/30/2007
{This space for State use only) i
RECEIVED
NOV 0 2 2007
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



NOTICE
Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-21 states that,

> A well is considered completed when the well has been adequately worked to be capable
of producing oil or gas or when well testing as required by the division is concluded.

> Within 30 days after the completion or plugging of a well, the following shall be filed:

+ Form 8, Well Completion or Recompletion Report and Log

* A copy of electric and radioactivity logs, if run

* A copy of drillstem test reports,

+ A copy of formation water analyses, porosity, permeability or fluid saturation
determinations

* A copy of core analyses, and lithologic logs or sample descriptions if compiled

* A copy of directional, deviation, and/or measurement-while-drilling survey for
each horizontal well

Failure to submit reports in a timely manner will result in the issuance of a Notice of Violation
by the Division of Qil, Gas and Mining, and may result in the Division pursuing enforcement
action as outlined in Rule R649-10, Administrative Procedures, and Section 40-6-11 of the
Utah Code.

As of the mailing of this notice, the division has not received the required reports for

Operator: _Gasco Production Company Today'’s Date: 02/14/2008

Well: API Number: Drilling Commenced:
Wilkin Ridge 43-29-10-17  drig rpts/wcr 4301333098 02/20/2007
Gate Cyn ST 23-16-11-15  drlg rpts/wcr 4301332685 04/25/2007
Federal 34-18-9-19 wer 4304737117 07/23/2007
State 22-32A drlg rpts/wcer 4304739171 08/19/2007
State 21-32B drig rptsiwer 4304739170 08/20/2007

/'S ISE ‘{p

To avoid compliance action, required reports should be mailed within 7 business days to:
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801
If you have questions or concerns regarding this matter, please call (801) 538-5284.

cc: Well File
Compliance File



FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES .
DIVISION OF QOIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER.
ML-47067
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS ‘,Jj{"“""'m TEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME

Donotuashilfomforpmpocdamdrﬂlnowmh,mmnﬂydnmmwmwmm.mmm,mm Gata Can n
anil horizontal isterais. Lisa APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL formn for such proposals. yo!

™7 TYPE OF WELL 3, WELL NAME and NUMBER:
onwell [J  GASWELL /]  OTHER Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15
7. NAME OF OPERATOR: . AP NUMBER.
Gasco Production Company 4301332685
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT-
8 Inverness Dr E, Ste 100 Englewood Co 80112 (303) 483-0044 Gate Canyon - Wildcat
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT sURFace: 1895' FSL & 2007 FWL county: Duchesne
QTRAQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RaNGE, MeriDN: NESW 16 118 15E STATE: UTAH
1 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION — o TYPE OF ACTION —
NOTICE OF I [ acize DEEPEN [T] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
{Submit in Dupticets) ] AterR CASING [C] FRACTURE TREAT [ siwerrack 1o REPAIR WELL
Approximaty date work wil start [] casncRrerar [[] wewconsTrRucTION [[] mempORARILY ABANDON
[J cnance 1o PREVIOUS PLANS [[] orerator cHANGE [ ruemcrerar
] crance TueiNG ] Pruc anp asanpon [ venvoreuare
[0 susseauent reporT [J crance werL Name [ ruesack [ warerbisposa
(Subemit Original Form Only)
Dete of work " [J cHance weLL sTATUS [[] PRODUCTION (STARTRESUME) [[] wavER sHUT-OFF
compisson [] commmcie proouciNG FOrRMATIONS [T RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE O oner
[ converrwer Tvee [[] RecompLeTE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

This well is currently permitted to 11,815 Gasco Production Co would like to attempt to complete this well within the Dakota at

16,500'".

The maximum anticipated mud weight will be 12.5# gallon

The current permit allows for 8-5/8" surface casing to be run to 2685 - instead we will run 9-5/8" 40# N-80 LTC to 5000'. We will
cement it in place with 647 sx of Hi-Lift. (Please see attached cement dasign)

We will also run 5-1/2" 23# High-oollapé%"E‘ LTC production casing in place of 4-1/2" pipe. The cement design has been

revised to accommodate the additional depth and will be as follows: (please see the full attached cemeebm )l'

523 sacks of 35:65 Poz "G" 11.5 PPG, 3.05 yield TO GPERATOR
1611 sacks 50:50 Poz "G", 14.1 PPG, Yield =1.28 cu.ft/sk . '2_2‘ _zgg
This cement design should result in a cement top at 2500'. if hole conditions indicate, the number Date:

of sacks of cement will be increased to achieve a calculated cement top of 2500'. Final top of initials: %
cement will be verified by CBL. R &

A geological prognosis is attached.

A 10K BOP, a 10K double BOP and a 5 K annular bop will be used to drill out from under the 13 3/8" casing.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) SL\W\ M?K:nnon TITLE He&ugngy ng[miufﬁ@
svcmrunswsw oare OZ 'gb!OB Amende Son &r-{ A‘ﬂ((C‘— Z/Y/OY

{This space for State use only)

TATE RECEIVED
D BY THE S1 A
{572000) APSROVE D\\I\S\ON Sg(smnmwomonkmsm) FEB 2 ﬁ 2008

DIV, OF OlL, GAS & MINING




Gasco Production Company
Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15
NESW 16-11S-15E
1895’ FSL, 2007’ FWL
Duchesne County, Utah
API 43013326850000
Geological Prognosis 2/19/08

TIGHT HOLE working
Elevation: 6817.0’ graded ground
6841 > KB est. (may change a little)
Green River Formation: Surface
Wasatch Formation: +3160 3681
Mesaverde Formation: -990 7831
Lower Mesaverde -2770 9611
Castlegate Sandstone: -3580 10,241
Blackhawk Formation
Desert: -3820 10,661
Grassy: -4000 10,841
Sunnyside: -4140 10,981
Kenilworth -4420 11,261
Aberdeen -4620 11,461
Mancos -4695 11,536
Dakota -9300 16,141
TD 16,440
Logging program: Baker Atlas:
Run 1

From surface casing point (~5000’) to base of conductor
(339°) (12.25” hole)

Grand Slam Quad Combo HDIL-SP Deep Array, Density
with Pe, Neutron, Sonic

0-150 GR scale, 2.68 matrix density, 51.3 DTmatrix

GR to surface

Run 2

from surface casing point (~5000’) to TD (7.875” hole).
Drop 1

Grand Slam Quad Combo HDIL-SP Deep Array, Density
with Pe, Neutron, Sonic

0-150 GR scale, 2.68 matrix density, 51.3 DTmatrix



Drop 2
STAR Imager TD-11,200

Baker Atlas Vernal office 435.789.6460

Dispatching:

2154 Hwy 6 & 50

Grand Junction, CO 81505

Steve Espinosa, District Manager
Main Office 970.263.7453

Fax 970.263.9041

Cell 970.261.6611
steve.espinosa@bakeratlas.com

Baker Atlas

247 Industrial Drive (PO Box 1740)
Rock Springs, WY 82901

Joe Spencer, District Manager
Main Office 307.382.2960

Fax 307.382.2963

Cell 307.354.6682
joseph.spencer@bakeratlas.com

Mudlogging: Great Divide Consulting from casing point @ ~5000°-TD.
Penn Selman
Manager
Great Divide Consulting, Inc
420 Ridge Ave
Rock Springs, Wyoming 82901
Office 877.982.7471
Cell 307.350.5122
Logging trailer aaa.bbb.cccc

Cores: None planned.
DST’s: None planned.

Rig: Nabors 169, xxxxxxxxxxx, Company Man 435.yyyyyyy
Sat. phone zzzzzzzz

Fax wwwwwww
gascorigl 69@bbbbbbbbb.com




Data Distribution

Gasco Energy, Inc

8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100
Englewood, CO 80112

Attn. Mike Decker

303.483.0044 (office)
303.204.3880 (cell)
303.483.0011 (fax)

alternate: Robin Dean 303.483.0044 (office)
303.996.1814 (office direct)
303.377.8594 (home)
720.271.0881 (cell)

alternate: Rob Klebieko 303.483.0044 (office)
303.996.1824 (office direct)
303.840.2243 (home)
303.513.1472 (cell)

Baker Atlas: email LAS files from wellsite ASAP to Mike Decker
(deckermk@aol.com),Robin Dean (rdean@gascoenergy.com)
Robin Dean at home (search4oil@aol.com) Rob Klebieko
(rklebieko@gascoenergy.com) and Rob Klebieko at home
(thk7799@yahoo.com).
Four sets final log prints

Great Divide: Daily morning mudlog emailed to Mike Decker
(deckermk(@aol.com), Robin Dean (rdean{@gascoenergy.com),
Robin Dean at home (search4oil@aol.com), Rob Klebieko
(tklebieko@gascoenergy.com), Rob Klebieko at home
(thk7799@yahoo.com), and Chuck Wilson
(cwilson@gascoenergy.com)

XTO Energy Inc.

810 Houston Street

Fort Worth, TX 76102
817.870.2800 (main phone)

Primary contact
Glen Christiansen
Division Geologist
817.885.2352



glen_christiansen@xtoenergy.com

Alternate contact

Matt Yarnall

Senior Reservoir Engineer
817.885.2765
matt_yarnall@xtoenergy.com

Notify Glen Christiansen and Matt Yarnall of spud, coring, drillstem testing and intention
to run production casing or plug

Baker Atlas: set up Glen Chrirtiansen for WellLink
Email LAS and Image Files in TIF format to
new_drills@xtoenergy.com, Glen Christiansen and Matt Yarnall
3 sets log prints

Great Divide: Daily reports and mudlog emailed to Glen Cristiansen and Matt
Yarnall

BLM

170 South, 500 East
Vernal, Utah 84078-2799
Attn. Matt Baker

Baker Atlas: LAS file emailed to UT_VN_ Welllogs@BLM.gov
Great Divide: One final log
State of Utah

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

1594 West Temple North Suite 1210

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Baker Atlas: One set final log prints
Great Divide: One final log



Casing Cementing Proposal

Company: GASCO ENERGY, INC
Well Name: GCS 23-16-11-15
Field: Riverbend Unit
County: Uintah

State: UT

Date: 2/20/2008
Well Location:
API/UWI Number:
Proposal Number:
Contact: Chuck Wilson
cwilson@gascoenergy.com
303-996-1801

Objective: Cement into place 5000 ft. of 9-5/8", 40 Ib/ft
casing. Bid DOES include Top Out Cement.

Disclaimer Notice
This information is presented in good faith, but no warranty is given by and Schiumberger assumes no liability for advice or recommendations made
concerning the use of any product or service. The results given are based on bya model including various

assumptions on the well, reservoir and treatment The results depend on input data provided by the C nnd as to data and
can be no more accurate than the model, the assumptions and such input data. The i 's bast estimate of the
results that may be achieved and should be used for comparison purposes rather than absolute values. The qual«y of input data, and hence results,
may be improved through the use of certain tests and procedures which Sct can assist in ing. Freedom from infringement of patents

of Schlumberger or others is not to be inferred nor are any such rights granted unless expressly agreed to in writing




EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

Enclosed are our recommendations for Schiumberger intervention on the referenced well.
The proposal includes well data, design data, materials and resources requirements and cost
estimates. The purpose of our services is to perform a Casing Cementing treatment.

Schlumberger has established a safety policy to which all Schlumberger personnel must
adhere. A pre-job safety meeting will be held with customer representatives and other on
location personnel to familiarize everyone with existing hazards and safety procedures. We
would appreciate close cooperation between the customer representative and the
Schlumberger representative to insure a safe operation.

The estimated total cost of our services is $ 34,814.92. All costs are estimates only. Actual
costs will be determined by time, material and equipment used during treatment. Taxes are
not included. All work will be subject to Schlumberger then-current General Terms and
Conditions or to the terms and conditions of a Master Service Agreement if one is in force
between Schiumberger and Customer. This quote is valid for a period of thirty (30) days from
the date submitted.

Thank you for considering Schlumberger for this intervention.
Please do not hesitate to contact me with any questions or concerns.

Sincerely,

Jason Hamil
435-828-2393
jhamil@slb.com

Schiumbergep



Well Data
Job Type:

WELL DATA

Total Depth (Measured):

True Vertical Depth (TVD):

Bottom Hole Static Temperature (BHST):
Bottom Hole Circulating Temperature (BHCT): 108 degF

Casing Cementing
5000.0 ft
5000.0 ft
140 degF

< [
Open Hole
Mean Diameter without Excess | Bottom Depth [Annular Excess
% 12.250 in 5000.0 ft 100.0 %
ob | Weight | Grade | Thread | Capacity %‘;‘;‘:,T
s 13 3/8 in | 54.5 Ib/ft K-55 BTC 0.87 ft3/ft | 220.0 ft
oD Weight Grade Thread Capacity B;:::::'
% 9 5/8in | 40.0 Ib/t K-55 STC 0.43 ft3/ft | 5000.0 ft
Well Fluid Sequence
Open Hole / Casing Annular Capacity (without Excess): 0.31 ft3/ft
Previous Casing / Casing Annular Capacity (without Excess):
0.36 ft3/ft
Fluid Name Volume Density Top of Fluid
bbl Ib/gal ft
Spacer 40 8.32 0.0
Lead Slurry 492 11.00 0.0
Tail Slurry 59 14.20 4500.0
Displacement 376 8.60 0.0
Total Liquid Volume: 967 bbl

Schiumbergep



FLUID SYSTEMS

Density 8.32 Ib/gal
Additives
Total volume 40 bbl
2dQ b4 d c 0 H
Density 11.00 Ib/gal
Yield 3.98 ft3/sk
Mixed Water 25.644 gallsk
Mixed Fluid 25.644 gallsk
D044 50 %BWOW
D020 120 % BWOB
D079 1.0 % BWOB
Additives D112 0.2 %BWOB
D130 0.125 Ib/sk
D046 0.2 %BWOB
D907 94 Ib/sk
Expected Thickening Time 70 Bc at 05:00 hr:mn
Expected Compressive Strength
Expected Fluid Loss
Total volume 492 bbl
3 U0 83 J A OT Ble
Density 14.20 Ib/gal
Yield 1.61 ft3/sk
Mixed Water 8.064 galisk
Mixed Fluid 8.064 galisk
D053 10.0 % BWOB
Additives D130 0.125 Ib/sk
D907 94 Ib/sk

Expected Thickening Time

70 Be at 03:30 hr:mn

Expected Compressive Strength

Expected Fluid Loss

Total volume

59 bbl

Some of the chemicals specified in this program may have toxic properties. All personnel should be familiar with the inherent
dangers and appropriate safeguards to prevent accidental injury. Use of the chemicals may be governed by certain laws and
regulations and should only be used in accordance with such. Please refer to the MSDS sheets for the recommended safety

precautions and required minimum personal protective equipment.

Schiumbenrger



PROCEDURES
|

1. Ml (Move in) Schlumberger equipment.

2. Conduct Rig-up, Prime-up and pressure test safety meeting.

3.  RU (Rig up) Schlumberger equipment and pressure test to customer master valve.

4. Conduct pre-job safety meeting.

5. Perform treatment per design pumping schedule and instructions of client representative.
6. Conduct post job rig down meeting.

7. Rig down Schlumberger equipment.

8. Conduct convoy meeting and move out Schlumberger equipment.

5 Schiumberger



PRICE ESTIMATE

t and Services

Unit List Total List bi ¢ Discounted
e . nitLis Price iscoun Price
Code WRS Description Quantity Price s Rate .
48019000 Bulk Unit, Cement Add Hr 12 HR 230.00 2,760.00 73.0 % 745.20
48020000 Pump, Cement Add Hr 2 HR 1,210.00 2,420.00 73.0 % 653.40
48021000 Silo, Cement 1 EA 1,220.00 1,220.00 73.0 % 329.40
48021001 Mileage Cement Silo 140 Ml 9.95 1,393.00 73.0 % 376.11
48601000 Cement Plug Container 1 JOB | 1,113.00 1,113.00 73.0 %) 300.51
49100000 Cement Blending Charge 1169 CF 4.86 5,681.34 73.0 % 1,533.96
49102000 Transportation, Cement Ton-mile 3593 MI 3.58 | 12,862.94 73.0 % 3,472.99
56704095 Plug, Top Rubber Alum Core 9.625 in 1 EA 677.00 677.00 73.0 % 182.79
59200002 Transportation, Mileage Heavy Vehicles 140 MI 9.53 1,334.20 73.0 % 360.23
59200005 Transportation, Mileage Light Vehicles 140 MI 5.51 771.40 73.0 % 208.28
59697004 CemCAT« Monitoring System 1 JOB | 1,880.00 1,880.00 73.0 % 507.60
102871050 | Pump, Casing Cement 4501-5000 ft 1 EA 6,700.00 6,700.00 73.0 %| 1,809.00
102946000 | Fuel Surcharge (no discount), per truck 5 EA 325.00 1,625.00 0.0 % 1,625.00
107138100 | Circulating Equipment before job 1 EA 2,990.00 2,990.00 73.0 % 807.30
107182000 | Swedge, HP Integral 1 JOB 232.00 232.00 73.0 % 62.64
107264001 Regulatory Conformance Charge 5 EA 725.00 3,625.00 73.0 % 978.75
Subtotals: 47,284.88 13,953.16

* Please see Executive Summary for further information.

Unit List Total List bi ¢ Discounted
. 4 . ni IS Price Iscoun Price
Code WRS Description Quantity Price . Rate .
D020 Bentonite Extender 7825 b 0.70 | 5,477.50 73.0 % 1,478.93
D044 Granulated Sodium Chloride 7291 b 0.66 | 4,812.06 73.0%| 1,299.26
D046 Antifoam Agent, All Purpose 131 b 10.37 | 1,358.47 73.0%| 366.79
D053 Gypsum 1933 b 140 | 2,706.20 73.0%| 730.67
D079 Chemical Extender 653 Ib 448 | 2,925.44 73.0%| 789.87
D112 FLAC« Fluid Loss Additive 164 |b 30.45 | 4,993.80 73.0% 1,348.33
D130 Polyester Flake 113 b 9.02 1,019.26 73.0% 275.20
D907 Cement, Class G 900 ft3 42.15 [37,935.00 73.0 %| 10,242.45
D907 Cement, Class G (Top Out) 360 ft3 42.15 [15,174.00 73.0 % 4,096.98
S001 Calcium Chloride 77% concentration 600 b 1.44 864.00 73.0 % 233.28
Subtotals: 77,265.73 20,861.76
Total List Price: $ 124,550.61
Total Discount: $ 89,735.69
Job Price Estimate*: $ 34,814.92

Schiumberger



Casing Cementing Pl;&opo§a|u

Company: GASCO ENERGY, INC
Well Name: GCS 23-16-11-15
Field: Riverbend Unit
County: Uintah

State: UT

Date: 2/20/2008
Well Location:
API/UWI Number:
Proposal Number:
Contact: Chuck Wilson
cwilson@gascoenergy.com
303-996-1801

Objective: Cement into place 16,500 ft, 5-1/2", 23 Ib/ft
casing.

Disclaimer Notice
This information 1s presented in good faith, but no warranty is given by and Schiumberger assumas no Ilablllty for advice or recommendations made
concerning the use of any product or service. The results given are esti based on d by & model i g various

assumptions on the well, reservoir and treatment. The results depend on input data provided by the Customar and sstimates as to unknown data and
can be no more accurate than the model, the assumptions and such input data The inft is Schl ger's best estimate of the
results that may be achieved and should be used for comparison purposes rather than absolute values The quality of input data, and hence rasults,
may be improved through the use of certain tests and p which Schl can assist in ing. Fraedom from infringement of patents

of Schlumberger or others is not to be inferred nor are any such rights granted unless expressly agreed to in writing




EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

Enclosed are our recommendations for Schiumberger intervention on the referenced well.
The proposal includes well data, design data, materials and resources requirements and cost
estimates. The purpose of our services is to perform a Casing Cementing treatment.

Schlumberger has established a safety policy to which all Schlumberger personnel must
adhere. A pre-job safety meeting will be held with customer representatives and other on
location personnel to familiarize everyone with existing hazards and safety procedures. We
would appreciate close cooperation between the customer representative and the
Schlumberger representative to insure a safe operation.

The estimated total cost of our services is $ 82,384.60. All costs are estimates only. Actual
costs will be determined by time, material and equipment used during treatment. Taxes are
not included. All work will be subject to Schlumberger then-current General Terms and
Conditions or to the terms and conditions of a Master Service Agreement if one is in force
between Schlumberger and Customer. This quote is valid for a period of thirty (30) days from
the date submitted.

Thank you for considering Schlumberger for this intervention.
Please do not hesitate to contact me with any questions or concerns.

Sincerely,

Jason Hamil
435-828-2393
jhamil@slb.com

Schiumherger



10000

20000

Well

Fluid Sequence

WELL DATA

Well Data

Job Type: Casing Cementing
Total Depth (Measured): 16500.0 ft

True Vertical Depth (TVD): 16500.0 ft

Bottom Hole Static Temperature (BHST): 280 degF

Bottom Hole Circulating Temperature (BHCT): 228 degF

Ope ole
Mean Diameter without Excess | Bottom Depth [Annular Excess
7.875in 16500.0 ft 14.0 %

Previous Casing

OD | Weight | Grade | Thread | Capacity %‘g:)‘:,’:‘

95/8in | 40.0 Ib/ft K-55 STC 0.43 ft3/ft | 5000.0 ft

Bottom

oD Weight | Grade | Thread | Capacity Depth
51/2in | 23.0Ib/ft | P-110 LTC 0.12 ft3/ft  [16500.0 ft|

Open Hole / Casing Annular Capacity (without Excess): 0.17 ft3/ft
Previous Casing / Casing Annular Capacity (without Excess):
0.26 ft3/ft

FLUID PLACEMENT

Schlumherger



Fluid Name Density Top of Fluid
bbl Ib/gal ft
CW100 20 8.33 2298.7
Spacer 20 8.32 27293
Lead Slurry 164 13.00 3160.0
Tail Slurry 110 14.10 7300.0
EASYBLOK 218 14.10 10400.0
Displacement 348 8.34 0.0
Total Liquid Volume; 880 bbl

FLUID SYSTEMS

Density 8.33 Ib/gal

Additives
Total volume 20 bbl
) d -
Density 8.32 Ib/gal
Additives
Total volume 20 bbl
Lead Slurry (464 sacks, 94 |Ib per sack of Blend
Density 13.00 Ib/gal
Yield 1.98 ft3/sk
Mixed Water 10.864 gal/sk
Mixed Fluid 10.864 gal/sk
D020 5.0 %BWOB
D174 2.0 %BWOB
D112 0.7 % BWOB
Additives D046 0.2 %BWOB
D013 0.6 %BWOB
D130 0.125 Ib/sk
D907 94 Ib/sk
Expected Thickening Time
Expected Compressive Strength
Expected Fluid Loss
Total volume 164 bbi

F-

Schiumhepger




Density 14.10 Ib/gal
Yield 1.53 ft3/sk
Mixed Water 7.031 gal/sk
Mixed Fluid 7.031 gal/sk
D020 20 %BWOB
D046 0.1 %BWOB
D198 0.4 %BWOB
- D167 0.2 % BWOB
Additives D065 0.2 %BWOB
D066 35.0 %BWOC
D907 47 Ib/sk
D035-CF 37 Ibssk
Expected Thickening Time
Expected Compressive Strength
Expected Fluid Loss
Total volume 110 bbl
EASYBLOK (794 sacks, 84 Ib per sack of Blend)
Density 14.10 lb/gal
Yield 1.54 ft3/sk
Mixed Water 6.953 galisk
Mixed Fluid 6.953 gal/sk
D400 0.9 %BwOB
D202 0.2 %BwoOB
D154 70 %BWOB
i D046 0.2 %BWOB
Additives D066 162 % BWOB
D198 05 %BWOB
D307 47 Ib/sk
D035-CF 37 lbisk
Expected Thickening Time
Expected Compressive Strength
Expected Fluid Loss
Total volume 218 bbi

Some of the chemicals specified in this program may have toxic properties. All personnel should be familiar with the inherent
dangers and appropriate safeguards to prevent accidental injury. Use of the chemicals may be governed by certain laws and

regulations and should only be used in

accordance with such. Please refer to the MSDS sheets for the recommended safety

precautions and required minimum personal protective equipment.

Schiumberger




PROCEDURES
R

1.  MI(Move in) Schlumberger equipment.

2. Conduct Rig-up, Prime-up and pressure test safety meeting.

3. RU (Rig up) Schlumberger equipment and pressure test to customer master valve.

4. Conduct pre-job safety meeting.

5. Perform treatment per design pumping schedule and instructions of client representative.
6. Conduct post job rig down meeting.

7. Rig down Schlumberger equipment.

8. Conduct convoy meeting and move out Schlumberger equipment.

; Schlumberger
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PRICE ESTIMATE

t and Services

Unit List Total List bi ¢ Discounted
s g - nitLis Price Iscoun Price
Code WRS Description Quantity Price . Rate s
48019000 Bulk Unit, Cement Add Hr 16 HR 230.00 3,680.00 73.0 %) 993.60
48021000 Silo, Cement 2 EA 1,220.00 2,440.00 73.0 %) 658.80
48021001 Mileage Cement Silo 280 MI 9.95 2,786.00 73.0 % 752.22
48601000 Cement Plug Container 1 JOB| 1,113.00 1,113.00 73.0 % 300.51
49100000 Cement Biending Charge 2142 CF 486 | 10,410.12 73.0 %| 2,810.73
49102000 Transportation, Cement Ton-mile 6028 Mi 3.58 | 21,580.24 73.0 %| 5,826.66
59200002 Transportation, Mileage Heavy Vehicles 140 Ml 9.53 1,334.20 73.0 % 360.23
59200005 Transportation, Mileage Light Vehicles 140 MI 5.51 771.40 73.0 % 208.28
59697004 CemCAT« Monitoring System 1 JOB | 1,880.00 1,880.00 73.0 %) 507.60
102871165 | Pump, Casing Cement 16001-16500 ft 1 EA [37,800.00 | 37,800.00 73.0 %| 10,206.00
102946000 | Fuel Surcharge (no discount), per truck 6 EA 325.00 1,950.00 0.0 %| 1,950.00
107182000 | Swedge, HP Integral 1 JOB 232.00 232.00 73.0 % 62.64
107264001 Regulatory Conformance Charge 6 EA 725.00 4,350.00 0.0 %| 4,350.00
Subtotals: 90,326.96 28,987.27

Unit List Total List bi ¢ Discounted
er - nitLis Price iscoun Price
Code WRS Description Quantity Price s Rate ”
D013 Retarder 262 Ib 573 | 1,501.26 73.0%| 405.34
D020 Bentonite Extender 2858 Ib 0.70 | 2,000.60 73.0%| 540.16
D035-CF LITEPOZ« 3 Extender 468 ft3 16.85 | 7,885.80 73.0 % 2,129.17
D046 Antifoam Agent, All Purpose 255 b 10.37 | 2,644.35 73.0%| 713.97
D065 TIC« Dispersant 68 Ib 16.05 | 1,091.40 73.0% 294.68
D066 Silica Flour 17481 Ib 0.66 |11,537.46 73.0 %| 3,115.11
D112 FLAC« Fluid Loss Additive 327 b 30.45 | 9,957.15 73.0 % 2,688.43
D130 Polyester Flake 58 Ib 9.02 523.16 73.0% 14125
D154 Extender, LT 4667 Ib 3.06 {14,281.02 73.0 %| 3,855.88
D167 UNIFLAC«-S 68 Ib 93.40 | 6,351.20 73.0% 1,714.82
D174 Expanding Cement Additive 872 Ib 8.90 7,760.80 73.0 % 2,095.42
D198 Wide Temperature Range Retarder 469 Ib 29.85 [13,999.65 73.0% 3,779.91
D202 Low-Temperature Solid Dispersant D202 100 LB 48.00 | 4,800.00 73.0 % 1,296.00
D400 Gas Migration Prevention Additive 600 LB 105.80 |63,480.00 73.0 %{ 17,139.60
D827 Chemical Wash CW100 20 bbl 125.00 | 2,500.00 73.0%| 675.00
D907 Cement, Class G 1067 ft3 4215 |44,974.05 73.0 %| 12,142.99
L064 Clay Stabilizer 25 gal 99.20 | 2,480.00 73.0% 669.60
Subtotals: 197,767.90 53,397.33
Toftal List Price: $ 288,094.86
Total Discount: $ 205,710.26
Job Price Estimate*: $ 82,384.60

Schiumberger
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* Please see Executive Summary for further information.

; Schiumberger
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Pipe 0.D. Nominal Plain End . Wall Inside API Standard Alternate
(in) Weight Weight hickness Diameter Drift Diameter  Drift Diameter
{1b/%t) (Ib/ft) _{in) {in) {in) {in)
5.500 23.00 22.56 0.415 4.670 4,545 -
Plain End Plain End  Plain End Round  Round Thread Buttress Buttress Thread ST-L ANJO TCH
Product Collapse Body InternalYied { Thread Internal Yield Thread  Internal Yield Joint Joint Joint
Grade | WSS hangth  Mimum | Siength  Mimum | Swenth  Mimpwm | STogth  Strengih, Stength
Psit (100002 PSI3 (10001)4 PSS (1000 )s  PSt? (1000 16)° (100010} (1000 1)

N-80 11160 530 10560 502 9880 580 9000 339 389 530
N-80 HC 12730 530 10560 502 9880 580 3000 339 389 530
L-80 11160 530 10560 489 9880 551 9000 339 389 530
L-B0E 11160 570 11360 489 10620 551 9670 364 418 570
L-80 HC 11610 530 10560 489 9880 551 9000 338 389 530
L-80 eXtreme 11610 570 11360 489 10620 551 9670 364 418 570
C-90 12380 597 11880 514 11110 580 10120 381 438 597
€-90 HC 12730 597 11880 514 11110 580 10120 381 438 597
T-85 12940 630 12540 540 11730 609 10680 403 462 630
T-95 E 12940 663 13200 540 12350 609 11240 424 486 663
T-95 HC 13340 630 12540 540 11730 609 10680 403 462 630
T-95 eXtreme 13340 663 13200 540 12350 609 11240 424 486 663
C-95 12940 630 12540 540 11730 609 10680 403 462 630
C95E 12940 663 13200 540 12350 609 11240 424 486 663
C-95 HC 13340 630 12540 540 11730 609 10680 403 462 630
C-95 eXtreme 13340 663 13200 540 12350 609 11240 424 486 663
c-110 14540 729 14530 617 13580 696 12370 466 535 729
C-110 HC 14540 729 14530 617 13580 696 12370 466 535 729
14540 729 14530 643 13580 725 12370 466 535 729
P-{10E 14540 829 16510 669 15440 754 14060 530 608 829
P-11 16250 729 14530 643 13580 725 12370 466 535 729
~ P.110 eXtreme 16250 829 16510 669 15440 754 14060 530 608 829
—Q-125 L4 0y 16070 829 16510 694 15440 783 14060 530 608 829
— Q-125E 16070 895 17830 720 16670 812 15180 572 656 895
Q-125 HC 17340 829 16510 694 15440 783 14060 530 608 829
Q-125 eXtreme 17340 895 17830 720 16670 812 15180 572 656 895
TCA-140 17500 928 18430 772 17290 869 15740 593 681 928
TCA-150 18390 994 19810 823 18520 927 16870 636 728 994
TCA-80 GS 11160 530 10560 502 3880 580 9000 339 389 530
TCA-80 G55 11160 530 10560 489 9880 551 9000 339 388 530
TCA-90 GSS 12380 597 11880 560 11110 638 10120 381 438 597
TCA-95 GSS 129440 630 12540 540 11730 609 10680 403 462 630
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11-04 Gasco Gate Canyon St 23-16--11-15rev.

Casing Schematic

13-3/8"
MW 84
Frac 19.3

9-5/8"
MW 8.4
Frac 19.3

5000. MD

%3‘ M€ 54 :/c’/c\c
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Well name: 11-04 Gasco Gate Canyon St 23-16--11-15rev.

Operator: Gasco Production Company

String type:  Production Project ID:
43-013-32685

Location: Duchesne County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:

Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 12.500 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 75 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 306 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,500 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 2,396 ft

Burst

Max anticipated surface
pressure: 1,611 psi
Internal gradient: 0.552 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 10,714 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)
Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)
Tension is based on buoyed weight.
Neutral point: 13,412 ft
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft")

1 16500 5.5 23.00 P-110 LT&C 16500 16500 4.545 1962.6
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension  Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor

1 10714 14540 1.357 10714 13580 1.27 308 643 2.08J

Prepared  Clinton Dworshak Phone: (801) 538-5280 Date: February 26,2008
by: Div of Qil,Gas & Minerals Salt Lake City, Utah

Remarks:

Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 16500 ft, a mud weight of 12.5 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



Well name: 11-04 Gasco Gate Canyon St 23-16--11-15rev.

Operator: Gasco Production Company

String type:  Intermediate Project 1D:
43-013-32685

Location: Duchesne County

Design parameters:

Minimum design factors:

Environment:

Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 75 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 145 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 320 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 123 ft
Burst
Max anticipated surface
pressure: 4,400 psi
Internal gradient: 0.120 psi/ft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 5,000 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)
Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:
Next setting depth: 16,500 ft
Tension is based on buoyed weight.  Next mud weight: 12.500 ppg
Neutral point: 4,375 ft Next setting BHP: 10,714 psi
Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 5,000 ft
Injection pressure: 5,000 psi
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter = Capacity
(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft°)

1 5000 9.625 40.00 N-80 LT&C 5000 5000 8.75 2128.7
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor {Kips) (Kips) Factor

1 2182 3090 1.416 5000 5750 1.15 175 737 4219

Prepared  Clinton Dworshak Phone: (801) 538-5280 Date: February 26,2008

Salt Lake City, Utah

by: Div of Qil,Gas & Minerals

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 5000 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.

Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



_BOPE REVIEW

Well Name Gasco Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15 APl 43-013-32685
INPUT
Well Name Gasco Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15 APl 43-013-32685

String 1 __|String 2 String 3 String 4
Casing Size (") 13 3/8 9 5/8 51712
Setting Depth (TVD) 320 5000 16500
Previous Shoe Setting Depth (TVD) 0 320 5000
Max Mud Weight (ppg) 84 8.4 12.5
BOPE Proposed (psi) 90 10000 10000
Casing Internal Yield (psi) 1730 5750 16510]
Operators Max Anticipated Pressure (psi) 10700 12.5 ppg
Calculations | String 1 133/8 " |
Max BHP [psi] | .052*Setting Depth"MW =| 140

BOPE Adequate Fog Drilling And Setting Casing at Depth?

MASP (Gas) [psi] Max BHP-(0.12*Setting Depth) = 101 NO Flyeady se1—
MASP (Gas/Mud) [psi] Max BHP-(0.22*Setting Depth) = 69 NO '

*Can Full Expected Pressure Be Held At Previous Shoe?

Pressure At Previous Shoe | Max BHP-.22*(Setting Depth - Previous Shoe Depth) = 69 NO
Required Casing/BOPE Test Pressure 320|psi
*Max Pressure Allowed @ Previous Casing Shoe = O|psi *Assumes 1psi/ft frac gradient
Calculations | String 2 95/8 " |
.052"Setting Depth*MW =| 2184

[Max BHP [psi} |
|

BOPE Adequate For Drilling And Setting Casing at Depth?

IMASP (Gas) [psi] Max BHP-(0.12*Setting Depth) = 1584 YES
|[MASP (Gas/Mud) [psi] Max BHP-(0.22"Setting Depth) = 1084 YES
*Can Full Expected Pressure Be Held At Previous Shoe?
{Pressure At Previous Shoe | Max BHP-.22*(Setting Depth - Previous Shoe Depth) = 1154] «— NO
Required Casing/BOPE Test Pressure 4025 [psi [
*Max Pressure Allowed @ Previous Casing Shoe = \20 psi &/ *Assumes 1psifft frac gradient
Calculations | String 3 54/2 " |
Max BHP [psi] | .052*Setting Depth"MW =| 10725
BOPE Adequate For Drilling And Setting Casing at Depth?
MASP (Gas) [psi] Max BHP-(0.12"Setting Depth) = 8745 YES _
MASP (Gas/Mud) [psi] Max BHP-(0.22*Setting Depth) = 7095 YES
| *Can Full Expected Pressure Be Held At Previous Shoe?
|Pressure At Previous Shoe | Max BHP-.22*(Setting Depth - Previous Shoe Depth) = 8195| «— NO (Ruwrelpl
Required Casing/BOPE Test Pressure 10000lpsi |
*Max Pressure Allowed @ Previous Casing Shoe = ~5000[pst— *Assumes 1psi/ft frac gradient




ARNITIP T
STATE OF UTAH sVni Wk L FORM o
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES ‘ o
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
ML-47067
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N ALOTIEE OR TRIBE NAME

X o . 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to G t C
drill horizontal laterals, Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals, ate Lanyon

1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
oL wew [ GASWELL [/]  OTHER Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER.
Gasco Production Company 4301332685
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER. 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr E, Ste 100 . Englewood sy CO . 80112 (303) 483-0044 Gate Canyon
4. LOCATION OF WELL .

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 1895' FSL & 2007’ FWL county: Duchesne

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NESW 16  11S  15E STATE:

UTAH
11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

[ NoTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Dupticate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL -
Approximate date work will start: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON
CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR
CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE
SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL

(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion:

4/24/2007

RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE

NOOOOooad

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS otier: Well status update

CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

Ooboobooogano
Oobooooooo

2. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

This well was spud on April 24, 2007. The current drilled depth of this well is 350'. Drilling operations on this well will start
sometime within the next 2 weeks.

name pLeast privy ZBeverly Walker tme Engineering Tech

SIGNATURE /@({//}/ //Qé% | e 2129/2008

RECCIVED —
MAR 17 2008
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINiHT

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)



GASCO
Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

TS RIS S

Y 3013~

3% 35

GArE. cyy’
TIGHT HOLE

AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500 | Prog.Depth 16500 DATE 4/1/08 DAYS: 10
Current: Operations: WELD WELLHEAD
Depth: 4995' lProgress 0 |Dril| Hrs: 0 IAV ROP: #DIV/0! lFormation: Wasatch
DMC: $2,697 ITMC: $46,339 TDC: $74,831 |cwC: $1,585,132
Contractor: NABORS 169 |Mud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Jvw: 9.5  J#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit #: 2 3 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
viS: 43  |IsPm: 100 Size: 12.25 12.25 iSurf. Csg: $ - . |Rig Move: $ -
fpvive: 12/23 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: 311UD513 HC506Z Ilnt. Csg: $ - |paywork $ 19,500
Gel: 14/29 |sem: 60  |wre: ULTERRA | HUGHES |prodcss:  § - |rentar Tools: $ 2335
WL 24 GPM : 209 SIN: 4211 7011735 'Float Equp: $ - Trucking:
Cake: 2 {Press: 250 Jets: 5-18's 5- 14's 6-15'S Well Head: $ - Water:
JSolids: 9 AV DC: TD Out: 4366 4995 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel:
|MBT 13 AV DP: {Depth In: 2398 4366 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -
PH : 8.0 JetVel: IFTG: 1968 629 Tanks: $ - Logging:
Pf/M: .05/4.5 |ecp: Hrs: 40.5 27.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ 20,670
Chior: 11500 |sPR#1: surface FPH: 43.0 22.8 {Heater: $ - |sits: $ 25,000
ca : 10 |spr#z:  surface wos: 10k-30k | 1025 [pumpingm: _$ - ud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: IBtm.Up: 38 min R-RPM: 45/100 55/100 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 75
Time Break Down: Total D.T. JMRPM: 112 112 Misc: CMT $ - |consuitant: $ 1,300
START END TIME 0/279.5 TOTALl Total Rot. Hrs: 131.5 IDain Total: $ ~  |Drilling Mud: $ 2,697
06:00 06:30 0.5 CONDUCT JSA & SAFETY MEETING WITH CASING CREW AND RIG CREW Misc. / Labor: $ 1,655
06:30 14:00 7.5 CONTINUE RUNNING 9 5/8" CASING WITH T-REX CASING SERVICES. FILL EVERY 14Csg. Crew: $ 1,599
14:00 16:30 1.5 RU CIRC. HEAD AND WASH 15' OF FILL TO 4999' TD Daily Total: $ 74,831
15:30 17:30 2.0 CIRC. HOLE CLEAN - CASING WOULD NOT MOVE UP AFTER WASHING TO BOTTOM}Cum. wir: $ 55,319
17:30 18:00 0.5 RD CASING EQUIPMENT Cum. Fuel $ 96,025
18:00 18:30 0.5 CONDUCT SAFETY MEETING WITH CEMENTING CREW AND RIG CREW Cum. Bits: $ -
18:30 19:00 0.5 RU CEMENTERS - SCHLUMBERGER
19:00 22:00 3.0 JPUMP CEMENT: 320 SK LEAD - YIELD 3.89, WT 11#, H20 26.5 GAL/SK. TAIL - 510 SK G, DENS. 14.2, H20 7.91 GAL/SK,®
22:00 22:30 0.5 RIG DOWN CEMENTERS
22:30 01:00 2.5 RIG DOWN & FLUSH FLOWLINE. REMOVE CATWALK.
01:00 04:00 3.0 CUT CONDUCTOR, REMOVE CELLAR GRADING & K RAILS
04:00 06:00 2.0 PREHEAT AND WELD WELLHEAD BHA
Bit/ Torque § 2 4.40
[Motor 1 34.30
'M»’ FCF VED Jmonel 1 32.39
QPR ﬁ ZLUB Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go]12.125 I1BS | 1 7.31
Wasatch 3682 -1313' Mancos 11537 6542']8" D.C'S 2 62.39
A5 & MiNINfiresaverde 7832' 2837 Frontier 11815’ 6820712125185 | 1 7.22
Castlegate 10442 5447' Dakota 16142’ 11147'§8" D.C'S 3 89.12
|Desert 10662’ 5667' TD 16440' 11445'§X-0 1 3.16
Grassy 10982' 5987" 0 0'16.25D.Cc'S | 9 279.38
Sunnyside 11262' 6267 0 O'|TOTAL BHA = 515.27
Kenilworth 11262' 6267 o' 0'|Survey 16.5* 206"
24.00 |Aberdeen 11462' 6467’ BOILERI 12/ 228t |Survey 16.3* 4943'
P/U FLARE DRLG: NO Degasser NO BKG GAS Ou
S/0 FLARE TRIP: NO Gas Buster NO CONN GAS -
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 13 3/8" SET @ 363' KB PEAK GAS Ou
FUEL Used: 1500 On Hand: 7050 Co.Man Robert Chamberlin TRIP GAS N/A
BIT # 3 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP
| CONDITION 1 1 NO A X 1 NO D




TUS R I5E st
Yz-0I13- 3qL%s

GASCO GASCO ENERGY e Cut e
'E———"‘ DAILY DRILLING REPORT TIGHT HOLE
nergy AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500 | Prog.Depth 16500 DATE 4/2/08 DAYS: 11
Current: Operations: TESTING 9 5/8" CASING
Depth: 4995' IProgress 0 IDriII Hrs: 0 IAV ROP: #DIV/0! IFormation: Wasatch
DMC: $2,697 [tmc: $46,339 TDC: $57,338 fcwc: $1,642,470
Contractor: NABORS 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
mw: 9 #1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit #: 3 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 43 SPM: Size: 12.25 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 12/23 [#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: HC506Z Int. Csg: $ - Day Work $ 19,500
Gel: 14/29 |sPm: IMFG: HUGHES Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 2,335
WL 24 GPM : SIN: 7011735 Float Equp: $ - |trucking: $ 550
Cake: 2 Press: Jets: 6-15'S Well Head: $ - Water: $ 3,869
Isotias: 8.5 lavoc: D Out: 4995 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet $ 26,865
IMBT 13 AV DP: Depth In: 4366 {Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -
PH : 8.0 JetVel: IFTG: 629 Tanks: $ - Logging:
PIMF: .2/2.  |eco: Hrs: 27.5 Separator: $ - |Cement:
Chior: 2126 JsPr#1: |FPh: 22.8 |Heater: $ - |sits:
Ca : 10 ISPR #2: WOB: 10-25 PumpingLT:  § - IMud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: IBtm.Up: R-RPM: 55/100 JPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 75
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 112 IMisc: cMT $ - |Consultant: $ 1,300
START END TIME  J0/279.5 TOTALI Total Rot. Hrs: [ 131.5. 'IDain Total: $ - |orilling Mud: $ 1,004
06:00 18:00 12.0 NIPPLE UP BOP. SET SINGLE GATE, DOUBLE GATE, MUD CROSS, ANNULAR, CHOKHMisc. / Labor: $ 1,840
18:00 21:00 3.0 INSTALL CELLAR GRATING. HOOK UP ACCUMULATOR LINES. HAD TO MOVE ACCUl‘leg. Crew:
21:00 21:30 0.5 NOTICED WEEP HOLE LEAKING HYDRAULIC FLUID FROM UNDER TOP RAM OF DOUDaily Total: $ 57,338
21:30 22:00 0.5 TESTING PUMP QUIT WORKING - STARTED IT AGAIN - CONTINUED TESTING. Cum. Wir: $ 55,319
22:00 06:00 8.0 CONTINUE PRESSURE TESTING BOPE. NABORS MOBILIZED M&M (WEATHERFORD |Cum. Fuei $ 96,025
Cum. Bits: $ 25,000
REConmm
AR B ~
APR 07 2008
BHA
DIV, CF O”_ GAS & M!N!”!G Bit/ Torque § 2 4.40
JMotor 1 34.30
[Monet 1 32.39
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Gof12.125 IBS | 1 7.31
Wasatch 3682 -1313' Mancos 11537 6542']8" D.C'S 2 62.39
Mesaverde 7832' 2837' Frontier 11815' 6820']12.1251Bs | 1 7.22
Castlegate 10442' 5447' Dakota 16142' 11147'18"D.C'S 3 89.12
Desert 10662' 5667 TD 16440' 11445'}x-0 1 3.16
Grassy 10982' 5987" 0' 0'ls25DC’S | 9 279.38
Sunnyside 11262 6267 o' 0'JTOTAL BHA = 515.27
Kenilworth 11262 6267" 0 0'|Survey 16.5* 206'
24.00 |Aberdeen 11462’ 6467 BOILERI 12/228t |Survey [16.3* 4943’
P/U FLARE DRLG: NO Degasser NO BKG GAS Ou
S/O FLARE TRIP: NO Gas Buster NO CONN GAS -
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 95/8 SET@ 4999’ KB PEAK GAS Ou
FUEL Used: 1500 On Hand: 7050 Co.Man  Robert Chamberlin TRIP GAS N/A
BIT # 3 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP
| conpiITION 1 1 NO A X 1 NO D
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GASCO  GASCO ENERGY Y 3-O13=3 955"
“‘E“Hé'f“'g‘s; DAILY DRILLING REPORT TIGHT HOLE

AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500 Prog.Depth 16500 DATE 4/3/08 DAYS: 12
Current: Operations: DRLG CEMENT, FLOAT & SHOE. REPLACE ROTATING HEAD ASSEMBLY.
Depth: 4995 [Progress 0 prill Hrs: 0 |av roP: #DIV/O!  |Formation: Wasatch
DMC: $2,697 |T™MC: $46,339 TDC: $32,980 |cwe: $1,675,450.
Contractor: NABORS 169 |Mud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
{mw: 9 #1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Bit #: 3 4 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
vIS: 43 SPM: 35 Size: 12.25 8 3/4 1Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 8/7  1#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: HC506Z SWT116  |int. csg: $ - |paywork $ 19,500
Gel: 4/9 SPM: 35 IMFG: HUGHES SEC Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 2,435
WL: 24 GPM : 245 SIN: 7011735 D21285 |Float Equp: $ - Trucking:
Cake: 2 Press: 1000 Jets: 6-15'S 3-15'S Well Head: $ - Water:
ISolids: 8.5 AV DC: TD Out: 4995 5015 TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel:
IMBT 13 AV DP: 104 Depth In: 4366 4995 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -
PH : 8.0 JetVel: FTG: 629 Tanks: $ - Logging:
PHIME: .2/2.6 [eco: Hrs: 27.5 Separator: $ - Cement:
Chlor: 15000 |sPr#1: FPH: 22.8 Heater: $ - Isits:
Ca : 10  |sPrR#2: WOB: 10-25 10 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: IBtm.Up: 32 MIN R-RPM: 55/100 25 |Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 75
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 112 IMisc: CMT $ - Consultant: $ 1,300
START END TIME  }0/279.5 TOTALl Total Rot. Hrs: - 1315 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 835
06:00 06:30 0.5 CONTINUE PRESSURE TESTING. DURING LAST TEST (CASING) - PRESSURE TESTING PUMP FAILED. Misc. / Labor: $ 7,395
06:30 07:30 1.0 WAIT ON NEW PUMPING UNIT. LAY DOWN STABILIZERS. CLEAN ROTATING HEAD BOLTS. Csg. Crew: $ 1,440
7:30 10:00 2.5 THAW NEW PUMPING UNIT LINES. PRESSURE TEST CASING TO 4700 PSI - OK Daily Total: $ 32,980
10:00 10:30 0.5 BLOWDOWN CHOKE MANIFOLD & KILL LINES Cum. Wir: $ 55,319
10:30 15:30 5.0 INSTALL FLOW LINE, BOP TURNBUCKLES, CENTER STACK. INSTALL CATWALK & V-DOOR Cum. Fuel $ 96,025
15:30 16:00 0.5 INSTALL WEAR BUSHING. Cum. Bits: $ 25,000
16:00 20:00 4.0 LD 8" DC & TEST JOINT.
20:00 21.00 1.0 PU BIT, MOTOR, (11) 6" SPIRAL DC, STABILIZERS.
21:00 00:30 3.5  JMUBIT, TIH W/ BHA.
00:30 01:00 0.5 INSTALL ROTATING HEAD, ADJUST TURNBUCKLES ON STACK.
01:00 03:00 2.0 TIH. START CIRC 4 STDS OFF BOTTOM.
03:00 05:30 2.5 START TO TAG CEMENT AT 4883. DRLG CEMENT F/4883' T/4937". BHA
05:30 | 06:00 0.5 REPLACE ROTATING HEAD ASSEMBLY. Bit 1 1.00
IMotor 1 33.02
T el LV ey 6.5 DC 1 31.06
TN AL VL)
'_“D.D‘ g . 2998 Depth Feet To Go . Depth Feet To Go}7.125 IBS 1 5.58
Wasatch 3682' -1313' Mancos 11537 6542'16.5D.C. 2 527.00
ry A ng eab o sanpaAMesaverde 7832 2837 Frontier 11815’ 6820'|7.125188 | 1 4.58
D R el T 10442 5447' Dakota 16142 11147|esDc. |17 89.12
Desert 10662’ 5667' TD 16440 11445’
Grassy 10982’ 5987 0 0'
Sunnyside 11262 6267 0 0'JTOTAL BHA = 690.36]
Kenilworth 11262 6267 0 0'{Survey
24.00 |Aberdeen 11462 6467 BOILER| 127264t |survey
PV FLARE DRLG: NO Degasser NO BKG GAS Ou
S/O FLARE TRIP: Gas Buster NO CONN GAS -
IROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 9 5/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS Ou
|FUEL Used: 1050 On Hand: 12450 Co.Man  Robert Chamberlin TRIP GAS N/A
BIT # 3 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP
| CONDITION 1 1 NO A X 1 NO 1D




GASCO ENERGY
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AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500 | Prog.Depth 16500 DATE 4/7/08 DAYS: 16
Current: Operations: DRLG @ 7716'
Depth: 7716’ |Progress 560 IDriII Hrs: 12 IAV ROP: 46.7 IFormation: Wasatch
DMC: $9,758 [Tme: $67,155 TDC: $43981 |owc: $1,992363
Contractor: NABORS 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Jmw: 9.3 |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Bit #: 5 6 Conductor: $ - |LocCost: $ -
vIS: 40 SPM: 65 Size: 77/8 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 12/13 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: DP504ZX MS1666D [int. Csg: $ - Day Work $ 19,500
Gel: 5/18  |spm: 65 |MFG: HUGHES ULTERRA [Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,365
WL: 22 GPM : 454 IS/N: 7117390 4158 fFloat Equp: $ - Trucking:
Cake: 2 Press: 2200 Jets: 6-16'S 3-14'S 3-15'S]well Head: $ - Water:
Solids: AV DC: 563 D Out: 7209 TBG/Rods: $ - IFuet
MBT 7.5 AV DP: 266 Depth In: 5010 7209 IPackers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 9.0 JetVel: 115 FTG: 2146 507 Tanks: $ - Logging:
PfIMF: 1.35/7 Jecp: 9.4 Hrs: 55 10 Separator: $ - Cement:
Chior: 11000 |[sPr#1: 30stk 180 psi  JFpH: 39.0 50.7 JHeater: $ - |IBits: $ 6,048
Ca : 20 SPR #2 : 30stk 180 psi jwos: 20-25 10-25 IP g LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,800
Dapp ppb: 6 |Btm.Up: 34 min. ER-RPM 55 50-65 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 75
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM RPM: 68 73 IMisc: cMT $ - |consultant: $ 1,300
START END TIME }0/2835 TOTAl:I Total Rot. Hrs: & 2000 :IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 9,758
6:00 8:00 2.0 |DRLG F/7156' T/7209' 53' @ 26.5 FPH S Misc. / Labor: $ 1,320
8:00 9:00 1.0 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP EN{ tb ZIVEY Csg. Crew:
9:00 9:30 0.5 PUMP DRY PILL A QR_&?__ZQ% Daily Total: $ 43,981
9:30 | 10:00 0.5 |TOOH. ~ Cum. wr: $ 55319
10:00 | 10:30 0.5 |PULL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER s ~Ac 2 MINING  foum. Fuer $ 96,025
10:30 | 13:30 3.0 |TooH. RS . $ 25,000
13:30 14:00 0.5 DRAIN & CHECK MOTOR - OK. BREAK BIT. MU NEW BIT.
14:00 18:30 4.5 TIH. FILL PIPE @ 5100'.
18:30 19:30 1.0 WASH/REAM 3 STANDS TO BOTTOM - NO FILL. BHA
19:30 04:30 9.0 DRLG F/7209' T/7632' 423' @ 47 FPH. TROUBLESHOOT SURVEY TOOL IBit 1 1.00
4:30 5:00 0.5 SERVICE TOP DRIVE IMotor 1 32.90
5:00 6:00 1.0 DRLG F/7632' T/7716' 84' @ 84 FPH 6.5 Mone! 1 9.17
6.5 DC 1 31.06
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go]7.125 IBS 1 5.6
Wasatch 3682 -4034' Mancos 11537 3821'16.5 D.C. 2 62.08
Mesaverde 7832' 116’ Frontier 11815' 4099'17.125 I1BS 1 4.58
Castlegate 10442' 2726' Dakota 16142' 8426'] 6.5D.C. 17 528.01
Desert 10662’ 2946’ TD 16440’ 8724’
Grassy 10982' 3266' o o
Sunnyside 11262’ 3546 o O'JITOTAL BHA = 674.40
Kenilworth 11262' 3546’ o' 0'|Survey 5.1 7127
24.00 |Aberdeen 11462 3746 BOILERI 12/312t |Survey 5.3 7223
P/U 200K FLARE DRLG: NO Degasser NO BKG GAS 6-20 units
SI0 180K FLARE TRIP: Gas Buster NO CONN GAS 12-15 units
ROT. 190K LAST CSG.RAN: 9 5/8 SET@ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 23 units
FUEL Used: 1950 On Hand: 6000 Co.Man Robert Chamberlin TRIP GAS 118 UNITS
BIT # 5 ICS 0OCS bC LOC B/S G OoDC RP
| CONDITION 3 3 CT TIN X 1 wWT PR
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AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500 Prog.Depth 16500 DATE 4/8/08 DAYS: 17
Current: Operations: CUTTING DRLG LINE / TIH
Depth: 8012 IProgress 296 IDriII Hrs: 12 IAV ROP: 24.7 IFormation: Wasatch
DMC: $7,825 [rmc: $74,980 TDC: $70,358 Jewe: $2,062,721
Contractor: NABORS 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
fmw: 9.4  I#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit #: 6 7 Conductor: $ - |LocCost: $ -
VIS: 46 1SPM: 65 lSize: 77/8 7718 |Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
jPviyp: 18/9  |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: MS1666D DP506ZX __ |int. csg: $ - |pay work $ 19,500
Gel: 3/9/12 |[spPm: 65 JMFG: ULTERRA HUGHES [Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,365
WL 14 GPM : 454 ISIN: 4158 7118009 |Fioat Equp: $ - |¥rucking: $ 800
Cake: 2 Press: 2200 Jets: 3-14'S 3-15'S 6-16'S Well Head: $ - |water:
Jsolids: 7 AV DC: 563 TD Out: 8012 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ 26,878
IMBT 7.5 AV DP: 266 Depth In: 7209 8012 Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.5  |Jetvel: 115 IF1G: 803 Tanks: $ - |Logging:
Pf/Mf: 1.2/5.7 JECD: 9.4 Hrs: 22 |Separator: $ - Cement:
Chior: 12000 |ser#1:  30stk 180 psi freu: 36.5 Heater: $ - |ais: $ 8000
Ca : 20 ISPR #2: 30stk 180 psi |wos: 10-25 Pumping LIT:  $ - IMud Motors: $ 1,800
Dapp ppb: 6 IBtm.Up: 34 min. R-RPM: 50-65 |Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 75
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [M-RPM: 73 IMisc: cMT $ - |consultant: $ 1,300
START END TIME ]0/2835 TOTALI Total Rot. Hrs: '212.0 IDain Total: $ -~ {Drilling Mud: $ 7825
6:00 18:00 12.0 DRLG F/7716' T/8012' 296’ @ 25 FPH Misc. / Labor:
18:00 19:00 1.0 CIRC BOTTOMS UP - PUMP DRY PILL Csg. Crew:
19:00 23:00 40 TOOH Daily Total: $ 70,358
23:00 0:00 1.0 LAY DOWN MOTOR, SURVEY TOOOL, BIT Cum. Wtr: $ 55,319
0:00 1:30 1.5 PU NEW MOTOR, SURVEY TOOL AND BIT Cum. Fuel $ 96,025
1:30 2:30 1.0 TiH T/2500' Cum. Bits: $ 25,000
2:30 3:00 0.5 FILL PIPE - TEST NEW SURVEY TOOL - OK.
3:00 4:00 1.0 TIH T/ 4961 NI 2N
04:00 | 06:00 20 |suP & cuT DRLG LINE (98) V- TVLD BHA
APR 08 2008 IBit 1 1.00
[Motor 1 32.90
DIV_QOF QI GAS & MINING 6.5 Monel | 1 - 917
6.5 DC 1 31.06
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go]7.125 IBS 5.6
Wasatch 3682' -4330° Mancos 11537 3525'l6.5D.C. 2 62.08
{Mesaverde 7832' -180' Frontier 11815' 3803'17.125 IBS 1 4.58
Castlegate 10442’ 2430' Dakota 16142' 8130’} 6.5 D.C. 17 528.01
Desert 10662’ 2650' TD 16440’ 8428'
Grassy 10982' 2970" 0' 0'
Sunnyside 11262’ 3250 [} 0'ITOTAL BHA = 674.40
Kenilworth 11262' 3250 9} 0'|Survey 5.1 7127
24.00 |Aberdeen 11462' 3450' BOILERI 121324t |Survey 5.3 7223’
P/U 230K FLARE DRLG: NO Degasser NO BKG GAS 10-25 units
SIO 185K FLARE TRIP: Gas Buster NO CONN GAS 18-38 units
ROT. 205K LAST CSG.RAN: 9 5/8 SET@ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 40 units
FUEL Used: 1800 On Hand: 11400 Co.Man Robert Chamberlin TRIP GAS
BIT # 6 ICS 0oCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP
| CONDITION 3 2 CT T X 1 WT PR
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AFE # 40104
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500 Prog.Depth 16500 DATE 4/9/08 DAYS: 18
Current: Operations: DRLG AHEAD @ 8610°
Depth: 8610’ IProgress 598 IDriII Hrs: 19 1/2 lAV ROP: 30.7 IFormaﬁon: MESAVERDE
DMC: $7,825 |TMC: $74,980 TDC: $35,188 |jcwc: $2,097,909
Contractor: NABORS 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
[mw: 9.4  |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Bit #: 7 Conductor: $ - |LocCost: $ -
vIS: 42 SPM: 60 Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PV/YP: 13/14 {#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: DP506ZX Int. Csg: $ - Day Work $ 19,500
Gel: 7/15/28 {spm: 70 IMFG: HUGHES Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 3,365
WL: 15.6 lePMm: 454 SIN: 7118009 Float Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 2300 Jets: 6-16'S Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 7 AV DC: 566 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ -
MBT 7.5 AV DP: 151 Depth In: 8012 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.5 JetVel: 124 |FTG: 598 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
PfIMf: .8/5.8 ECD: 10.44 Hrs: 19.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 11000 |sPr#1: 30stk 180 psi |FPH: 30.7 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca : 20 SPR #2 : 30stk 180 psi |woOB: 25 Pumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ 5,652
Dapp ppb: 57 Btm.Up: 35 min R-RPM: 65 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 75
Time Break Down: Total D.T.  [M-RPM: 73 |misc: cmT $ - |consultant: $ 1,300
START END TIME  |0/283.5 TOTALI Total Rot. Hrs: 231.5 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 4,481
6:00 8:30 2.5 TRIP IN HOLE / BREAK CIRC. @ 5700’ Misc. / Labor:
8:30 9:30 1.0 WASH & REAM 300' TO BTM / TEST SURVEY TOOL Csg. Crew:
9:30 14:30 5.0 DRLG FR8012'- 8202 @ 38/HR est-top of mesaverde 8002' Daily Total: $ 35,188
14:30 15:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE / SERVICE TOP-DRIVE Cum. Wir: $ 55,319
15:00 18:00 3.0 DRLG FR 8202' - 8315’ @ 38/HR Cum. Fuel $ 96,025
18:00 4:00 10.0 DRLG FR 8315'- 8587' @ 27.2'HR Cum. Bits: $ 25,000
4:00 4:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE / SERVICE TOP-DRIVE
4:30 6:00 1.5 DRLG FR 8587'-8610' @ 15.3/HR
[T e T — BHA
P TIVE Bit 1 1.00
AP“ ﬂ g 2&;}8 Motor 1 33.02
6.5 Monel 1 9.12
S GF OlL GAS &-MINING e 2L
7.4251BS | 1 5.60
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go]6.5 D.C. 2 62.08
Wasatch 3682' 0' Mancos 11537 2927'17.1251BS 1 4.58
Mesaverde 8002' 0' Frontier 11815’ 3205’1 6.5D.C. 17 528.01
Castlegate 10442’ 1832' Dakota 16142' 7532’
Desert 10662’ 2052' TD 16440’ 7830
Grassy 10982' 2372 o' o'
Sunnyside 11262’ 2652’ o 0'|TOTAL BHA = 674.47
Kenilworth 11262’ 2652’ () 0'{Survey 7980 5.4/200
24.00 [Aberdeen 11462’ 2852' BOlLERI 127336t |Survey 8367/ 7.6/196
P/U 225K FLARE DRLG: NO Degasser NO BKG GAS 10-20 units
SI0 185K FLARE TRIP: NO Gas Buster NO CONN GAS 11-18 units
ROT. 211K LAST CSG.RAN: 9 5/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 90 units
FUEL Used: 1800 On Hand: 9600 Co.Man J.D. ALLEN TRIP GAS 94 units
BIT # 6 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP
| CONDITION 3 2 CT T X 1 WT PR
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AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500 Prog.Depth 16500 DATE 4/10/08 DAYS: 19
Current: Operations: DRLG AHEAD @ 9044'
Depth: 9044’ IProgress 434 |Dri|| Hrs: 22172 IAV ROP: 19.3 IFormation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $6,157 ITMC: $114,509 TDC: $46,082 Jcwc: $1,972,604
Contractor: NABORS 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
IMw: 94 #1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit # 7 Conductor: $ - |roc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 44 |SPM: 60 ISize: 77/8 JSurf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
levive: 15/15 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: DP5062X Ilnt. Csg: $ - |pay work $ 19,500
Gel: 6/23/28 |spm: 70 JMEG: HUGHES IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 9,672
fw: 14.8 _ |cem: 454 |sm: 7118009 [Frostequ:  $ - |trucking $ 475
Cake: 2 JPress: 2300 Jets: 6-16'S Well Head: $ - Water: $ 2,662
Jsolids: 7 AV DC: 566 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
IMBT 7.5 AV DP: 151 Depth In: 8012 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.5 JetVel: 124 |FTG: 1032 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ ~
PfIMf: .7/4.7 Jeco: 10.44 Hrs: 42 |Separator: $ - Cement: $ =
Chior: 11500 |SPR #: 30stk 280psi  |FPH: 246 Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 20 |SPR #2: 30stk 270 psi jwoB: 25 PumpingLIT:  § - |Mud Motors: $ 5426
Dapp ppb: 5 IBtm.Up: 37 R-RPM: 65 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 75
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [M-RPM: 73 Jmisc: cmt $ - |consuttant: $ 1,300
START END TIME  ]0/2835 TOTALI Total Rot. Hrs: 254.0 lDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 6,157
6:00 13:.00 7.0 DRLG FR 8610' - 8800' @ 27/HR Misc. / Labor: $ -
13:00 14:00 1.0 WORK TIGHT HOLE / SWEEP HOLE WITH HIGH VIS DRILLZONE SWEEP Csg. Crew: $ -
14:00 18:00 40 DRLG FR 8800'- 8867' @ 16.757HR |Daily Total: $ 46,082
18:00 23:00 5.0 DRLG FR 8867 - 8960' @ 18.67HR Cum. Wir: $ 55,319
23:00 23:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE / SERVICE TOP DRIVE JCum. Fuel $ 96,025
23:30 6:00 6.5 DRLG FR 8960’ - 9044' @ 12.9/HR Cum. Bits: $ 25,000
REACIVED
T ULV LT
APR 10 2038 BHA
|Bit 1 1.00
NIV OF Oll, GAS & MINING oor | 1 33.02
6.5 Monel 1 9.12
6.5 DC 1 31.06
adjustment in CWC due to casing costs twice and the daily cost being added twice on the 147.125 IBS 1 5.60
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Gol6.5 D.C. 2 62.08
Wasatch 3682 0' Mancos 11537 2493'17.125 IBS 1 4.58
|Mesaverde 8002' 0' Frontier 11815' 27711 6.5D.C. 17 528.01
Castlegate 10442' 1398' Dakota 16142' 7098
Desert 10662' 1618 TD 16440’ 7396'
Grassy 10982' 1938’ 0’ o'
Sunnyside 11262’ 2218’ o' O'|TOTAL BHA = 674.47
|Kenilworth 11262’ 2218’ o 0'JSurvey 8647 7.6/201
24.00 |Aberdeen 11462' 2418' BOILER| 127348t [survey | 8938] 89192
P/U 235k FLARE DRLG: NO Degasser NO BKG GAS 6-20 units_
SIO 190k FLARE TRIP: NO Gas Buster NO CONN GAS 10-23 units
ROT. 221k LAST CSG.RAN: 9 5/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 115 units
|FUEL Used: 2250 On Hand: 7350 Co.Man J.D. ALLEN TRIP GAS N/A
BIT # 6 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G oDC RP
| conpITION 3 2 cT T X 1 wT PR
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AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500 | Prog.Depth 16500 DATE 4/14/08 DAYS: 23
Current: Operations: JRIG REPAIR - CHANGE OUT LOW DRUM CLUTCH
[Depth:  9725' |Progress 220  |orin vrs: 12 |av roP: 18.3  Jrormation: MESAVERDE
lomc: $5,106 |rmc: $131,512 TDC: $51,526 |cwe: $2,135,145
IContractor: NABORS 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
IMW: 9.5 |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit #: 8 9 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 43 ISPM: 60 Size: 77/8 77/8 Surf. Csg: - Rig Move: $ -
IPvivp: 10/14 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: MS1388DEF | HC506ZX+ Jint. Csg: $ - |pay work $ 19,500
leet: 7/20/25 fsem: 70 |wre: ULTERRA | HUGHES [proacss:  § - |RentaiToots: $ 3850
Iwu.: 15.2 IGPM : 453 lsm: 5006 7114931  [Fioat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 IPress: 2350 Jots: 8-13'S 6/16's IWeII Head: $ - |water: $ -
Isolids: 74 JAavDc: 562 TD Out: 9725 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuek $ -
IMBT 7.5 Javoe: 150 Depth In: 9052 9725 Packers: $ - |mud Logger: $ 815
IPH : 8.3 Jetvel: 140 [FTG: 673 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
PriMmf: 4/5  Jeco: 10.3 lHrs: 41 Iseparator: $ - |cement: $ -
chior: 10500 fspr#1: _ 30stk 220psi_|re: 16.4 cater: $ - lois: $ 20,880
Ca : 40 ISPR #2: 30stk 220 psi jwos: 28 P gut: $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 4.8 IBtm‘Up: 41 R-RPM: 80 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 75
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 0 IMisc: cmT $ - |consuitant: $ 1,300
START END TIME 1304.5 TOTAL | Total Rot. Hrs: 295.5 IDain Total: $ - |orilling Mud: $ 5,106
6:00 7:00 1.0 IDRLG FR - 9505' - 9525' @ 20'HR Misc. / Labor: $ -
7:00 8:00 1.0 lRIG SERVICE - SERVICE TOP DRIVE Csg. Crew: $ -
8:00 19:00 11.0 IDRLG FR 9525'- 9725’ @ 18/HR |Daily Total: $ 51,526
19:00 20:00 1.0 C&C MUD MIX DRY JOB L/D PIPE IN V-DOOR PUMP DRY JOB PILL - NO FLOW Cum. Wir: $ 61,850
20:00 2:00 6.0 T.0.0.H. FOR BIT Cum. Fuel $ 203,904
2:00 3:30 1.5 L/D TORK BUSTER & BIT / P/U NEW BIT FUNCTION BLIND RAMS Cum. Bits: $ 57,880
3:30 6:00 2.5 T..H. TO CSG SHOE FILL PIPE & BREAK CIRC. INSTALL FLOOR VALVE
RECEIVED
BHA
APR—ITZUUB BIT/B.S. |1ea. 5.00
6.5D.C. 1 31.06
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING 6.5Monel | 1 9.12
6.5 DC 1 31.07
B.0.P. DRILL WITH BOTH CREWS WHILE DRILLING 7.125 IBS 1 5.60
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go}6.5 D.C. 1 31.01
[Wasatch 3682’ 0' Mancos 11537 1812')7.125 IBS 1 4.58
lMesaverde 8002' 0' Frontier 11815' 2090’} 6.5 D.C. 17 528.01
Castlegate 10442' 717" Dakota 16142' 6417'|HWDP 3 92.18
|Desert 10662' 937' TD 16440’ 6715'|DRLG JARS | 1 31.70
IGrassy 10982’ 1257 0' 0'fHWDP 18 551.85
Sunnyside 11262 1637 o 0'ITOTAL BHA = 1321.18
{Kenilworth 11262' 1537 o' 0'|Survey 10.2 9491’
24.00 |Aberdeen 11462' 1737 BOILER] 127432t |Survey 101] 9685’
|P/U 250k FLARE DRLG: NO _Degasser NO BKG GAS 20-45 units
S/0 150k FLARE TRIP: NO Gas Buster NO CONN GAS 27-82 units
ROT. 190k LAST CSG.RAN: 9 5/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 288 units
IFUEL Used: 1800 On Hand: 7500 Co.Man J.D. ALLEN TRIP GAS N/A
BIT# 8 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP
l CONDITION 1 2 WT S X IN CT PR




GASCO
Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

7HS KISE S
Y 3—0l3— 3 6BS

GHrE C¥t/ S~

TIGHT HOLE

AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500 | Prog.Depth 16500 DATE 4/15/08 DAYS: 24
Current: Operations: DRLG AHEAD @ 9782
Depth: 9782 |Progress 57  |orill Hrs: 31/2 |avror: 16.3  JFormation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $4,444 |TMC: $135,956 TDC: $27,400 |cwc: $2,162,545
Contractor: NABORS 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW 9.65 |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit #: 9 Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
vis: 53  Jsem: 60 size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - IRig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 18/20 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: HC5062X+ Jint. csg: $ - |Day work $ 6,500
Gel: 9/27/38 lSPM: 70 JMFG: HUGHES IProd Csg: $ 7,931 |Rental Tools: $ 3,850
wL: 15.2 GPM : 453 ISIN: 7114931 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 2350 Jets: 6/16's Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Isolids: 7 AV DC: 562 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ -
IMBT 7.5 AV DP: 150 Depth In: 9725 Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.4  |yetvel: 140 |Fre: 57 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
PEIMF: .36/5.3 |ecp: 10.27 Hrs: 35 Separator: $ - |cement: $ -
Chior: 12000 ISPR #: 30stk 220psi  |FPH: 16.6 JHeater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 20 ISPR #2: 30stk 220 psi |wos: 30 IPumping ur: $ - [Mud Motors: $ 1,950
Dapp ppb: 6.5 IBtm.Up: 41 R-RPM: 75 IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 75
Time Break Down: Total D.T.  |M-RPM: IMisc: cMT $ - |consultant: $ 1,300
START END TIME  }16/304.5 TOTALI Total Rot. Hrs: 299.0 :;lDaily Total: $ 7,931 [Drilling Mud: $ 4444
6:00 22:00 16.0 REPLACE LOW DRUM CLUTCH - WORK ON WT. INDICATOR - REPLACE HOSE ON TOP-DRIVE Misc. / Labor: $ 535
22:00 1:30 3.5 T.I.H. BREAK CIRC. @ 6000’ - 7000’ - 8000’ - 9000’ Csg. Crew: $ -
1:30 2:30 1.0 WASH & REAM 'TO BTM Daily Total: $ 27,400
2:30 6:00 35 DRLG FR 9725' - 9782' @ 16.3/HR Cum. Witr: $ 61,850
Cum. Fuel $ 203,904
Cum. Bits: $ 57,880
PITIT N
BT =A™ A AT~ BHA
APR 15 2008 [Br/BS. |1ea. 5.00
6.5 D.C. 1 31.06
i Ol GAS & MINING 6.5 Monel | 1 9.12
6.5 DC 1 31.07
7.125 IBS 1 5.60
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go}6.5 D.C. 1 31.01
Wasatch 3682" 0' Mancos 11537 1755'17.125 IBS 1 4.58
Mesaverde 8002' 0' Frontier 11815 2033']6.5D.C. 17 528.01
Castlegate 10442 660" Dakota 16142' 6360'|HWDP 3 92.18
Desert 10662’ 880" TD 16440 6658'|DRLG JARS | 1 31.70
Grassy 10982' 1200’ o' 0'|[HWDP 18 551.85
Sunnyside 11262’ 1480’ o 0'JTOTAL BHA = 1321.18
Kenilworth 11262’ 1480 o 0'|Survey
24.00 |Aberdeen 11462 1680’ BOILER| 12/444T [survey
PIU 250k FLARE DRLG: NO Degasser NO BKG GAS 22-45 units
S/0 150k FLARE TRIP: NO Gas Buster NO CONN GAS N/A
JROT. 190k LAST CSG.RAN: 9 5/8 SET@ 4999° KB PEAK GAS 1248 units
IFUEL Used: 1200 On Hand: 6300 Co.Man J.D. ALLEN TRIP GAS N/A
BIT # 8 ICS OoCs DC LOC B/S G ODC RP
| CONDITION 1 2 WT S X iN CT PR




GASCO
Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

TUS R I5E s
Y3—0)3~ 33695
GHRTE YA’
TIGHT HOLE

AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500 Prog.Depth 16500 DATE 4/16/08 DAYS: 25
Current: Operations: DRLG AHEA @ 9824°
Depth:  9824' |Progress 42 |Drill Hrs: 912 |avRop: 44  |rormation: LOWER MESAVERDE
DMC: $2,213 TMC: $138,169 TDC: $41,253 JCwc: $2,203,798
Contractor: NABORS 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
[mw: 9.6  |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit # 9 10 Conductor: $ - |rocCost: $ -
VIS: 47 SPM: 60 Isize: 77/8 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 13/17 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: HC506ZX+ | FMHX753ZR |int. Csg: $ - |pay work $ 19,500
Gel: 8/19 fsPm: 70 JMFG: HUGHES SECURITY IProd Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,350
WL: 14 GPM : 453 SIN: 7114931 11123233 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 2350 Jets: 6/16's 6/16's Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
|sotids: 708 Javoc: 571 TD Out: 9806 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuei: $ -
IMBT 10 AV DP: 152 Depth In: 9725 9806 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 815
IPH H 8.3 JetVel: 125 JFTG: 81 18 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
PfIM{: 2152 ECD: 10.36 Hrs: 7.5 5.5 |Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 10000 |sPR#1: 30stk 220psi  |FPH: 10.8 3.3 Heater: $ - |sits: $ 12,000
Ca : 40 ISPR #2: 30stk 220 psi JwoB: 15/30 10/18 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 5.6 IBtm.Up: 41 R-RPM: 55-75 70 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 75
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: Imisc: cmT $ - |consultant: $ 1,300
START END TIME /304.5 TOTAL I Total Rot. Hrs: 308.5 IDaily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 2,213
6:00 10:00 4.0 DRLG FR9782'-9806' @ 24' @ 6/HR Misc. / Labor: $ -
10:00 11:30 1.5 MIX & PUMP DRY JOB Csg. Crew: $ -
11:30 17:30 6.0 T.0.0.H. FOR BIT - 60K DRAG Daily Total: $ 41,253
17:30 18:30 1.0 BREAK OFF BIT / P/U NEW BIT / FUNCTION RAMS Cum. Wtr: $ 61,850
18:30 0:00 5.5 T.I.H./INSTALL ROT. HEAD AT CSG SHOE / BREAK CIRC. @ 5000' & 7500" Cum. Fuel $ 203,904
0:00 0:30 0.5 WASH & REAM 90' TO BTM - NO FILL Cum. Bits: $ 57,880
0:30 6:00 5.5 DRLG FR 9806' - 9824' @ 3.3/HR
REGEIVED
- BHA
APR 1 8 2008 Ier/Bs. [1ea. 5.00
lesoc. |1 31.06
DIV, OF QIL, GAS & MINING 6.5Monel | 1 9.12
6.5 DC 1 31.07
7.125 IBS 1 5.60
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go}6.5 D.C. 1 31.01
Wasatch 3682 0' Mancos 11537 1713']7.125 1BS 1 4.58
|Mesaverde 8002 0' Frontier 11815’ 1991'] 6.5 D.C. 17 528.01
Castlegate 10442' 618" Dakota 16142' 6318'|HWDP 3 92.18
Desert 10662 838' TD 16440 6616'|DRLG JARS | 1 31.70
Grassy 10982' 1158’ 0' O'|HWDP 18 551.85
Sunnyside 11262’ 1438 ) 0'ITOTAL BHA = 1321.18
Kenilworth 11262' 1438' o' 0'|Survey
24.00 |Aberdeen 11462 1638’ BOILER| 12/456T [survey
P/U 305K FLARE DRLG: NO Degasser NO BKG GAS 15/25 units
SI0 200K FLARE TRIP: NO Gas Buster NO CONN GAS N/A
ROT. 236K LAST CSG.RAN: 9 5/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 33 units
JFUEL Used: 1350 On Hand: 4850 Co.Man  J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS 58 units
BIT # 9 ICS 0oCSs DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP
| CONDITION 1 3 WT S X IN CT PR




GASCO
Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

TS RISE s-14

Y3~-0I3-336385
GATE cHn ST~

TIGHT HOLE

AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500 | Prog.Depth 16500 DATE 4/17/08 DAYS: 26
Current: Operations: DRLG AHEAD @ 9963’
Depth: 9963' IProgress 139 IDriII Hrs: 231/2 IAV ROP: 5.9 IFormation: LOWER MESAVERDE
DMC: $4,850 |TMC: $143,018 TDC: $34,052 |CwC: $2,237,850
Contractor: NABORS 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
mw: 9.6  J#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit #: 10 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 47  {sPm: 60 ISize: 77/8 lsurf. csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 13/17 |42 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FMHX753ZR Int. Csg: $ - |pay work $ 19,500
Gel: 8/19 |spm: 70 MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,950
WL: 14 GPM : 453 lSIN: 11123233 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 2350 Jets: 6/16's Well Head: $ - |water: $ 3,562
Isolids: 708 |avbc: 571 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel: $ -
IMBT 10 AV DP: 152 Depth In: 9806 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 815
IPH H 8.3 JetVel: 125 JFTG: 157 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
Pf/Mf: .2/5.2 Jecp: 10.36 Hrs: 29 |Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 10000 |sPrR#: 30stk 220psi _JrPH: 5.4 Heater: $ - |sits: 3 -
Ca : 40 SPR #2 : 30stk 220 psi JwWOB: 18/30 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
IDapp ppb: 5.6 |stm.up: 41 R-RPM: 55/70 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 75
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [M-RPM: |Misc: cmT $ - |Consultant: $ 1,300
START END TIME /304.5 TOTAL I Total Rot. Hrs: 332.0 IDaily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,850
6:00 20:30 14.5 DRLG FR 9824 - 9906' @ 5.8/HR Misc. / Labor: $ -
20:30 21:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE - SERVICE TOP DRIVE Csg. Crew: $ -
21:00 6:00 9.0 DRLG FR 9906’ - 9963' @ 6.3/HR Daily Total: $ 34,052
Cum. Wir: $ 61 ,850
Cum. Fuel $ 203,904
DECCIL En Cum. Bits: $ 57,880
Mt vies
APR 17 2008
BHA
DIV. OF OlL, GAS & MINING BIT/B.S. |1ea. 5.00
6.5D.C. 1 31.06
6.5 Monel 1 9.12
ADDED 2% DIESEL - 21bbls INTO ACTIVE SYSTEM 6.5 DC 1 31.07
7.125 IBS 1 5.60
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go|6.5 D.C. 1 31.01
Wasatch 3682' 0' Mancos 11537 1574'}7.125 IBS 1 4.58
Mesaverde 8002' 0' Frontier 11815 1852'} 6.5 D.C. 17 528.01
Castlegate 10442' 479 Dakota 16142 6179'|HWDP 92.18
Desert 10662' 699' TD 16440 6477'|DRLG JARS | 1 31.70
Grassy 10982’ 1019 0' Q'|[HWDP 18 551.85
Sunnyside 11262' 1299’ 0 O'JTOTAL BHA = 1321.18
Kenilworth 11262’ 1299 0 0’|Survey 9874 9.7/192
24.00 JAberdeen 11462 1499' BOILERI 12/468T |Survey
P/U 255K FLARE DRLG: NO Degasser NO BKG GAS 18/32 units
S/0 220K FLARE TRIP: NO Gas Buster NO CONN GAS 36 units
ROT. 237K LAST CSG.RAN: 9 5/8 SET@ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 110 units
FUEL Used: 3320 On Hand: 1630 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS N/A
BIT # 9 ICS 0OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP
| conDITION 1 3 WT S X IN CT PR




GASGO
Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

TUS Risg 54

Y7-0i7-35 635
TIGHT HOLE

Gé#{ 5898%5%% -1% .240942

AFE # 40104
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500' | Prog.Depth 16500° DATE 4/18/08 DAYS: 27
Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD @ 10023’
Depth: 10023’ IProgress 60 IDriII Hrs: 71/2 IAV ROP: 8.0 IFormation: LOWER MESAVERDE
DMC: $5,628 lT™C: $146,947 TDC: $77,698 |cwe: $2,315,548
Contractor: NABORS 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 9.6 |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit # 10 11 Conductor: $ - |LocCost: $ -
VIS: 47 ISPM: 60 lSize: 77/8 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 1317 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FMHX753ZR | HC506ZX+ |int. csg: $ - |pay work $ 19,500
Ge: 8/19 |sem: 70 |wre: SECURITY | HUGHES [prodcss: 8 - |rentai Tools: $ 3950
WL: 14 GPM : 453 ISIN: 11123233 7011378 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 2350 Jets: 6/16's 6/16's Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
|sotius: 708 Javoc: 571 TD Out: 9980 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuer $ 27,030
IMBT 10 AV DP: 152 Depth in: 9806 9980 [Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.3 JetVel: 125 FTG: 174 43 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
PFIMF: .2/5.2 |Jecp: 10.36 JHrs: 32 4.5 Iseparator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 10000 lSPR #1: 30stk 220psi__JFPH: 5.4 9.6 Heater: $ - |sits: $ 9,000
Ca : 40 lSPR #2: 30stk 220 psijwos: 18/30 15/20 Pumping LIT:  $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 5.6 IBtm.Up: 41 R-RPM: 55/70 55/70 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 75
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: |misc: cmT $ - |consuttant: $ 1,300
START END TIME /304.5 TOTAL I Total Rot. Hrs: 332.0 IDain Totak: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 5,628
6:00 9;00 3.0 DRLG FR 9963' - 9980° @ 5.67HR Misc. / Labor: $ 10,400
9:00 9:30 0.5 MIX & PUMP DRY JOB Csg. Crew: $ -
9:30 17.00 7.5 T.0.0.H. FORBIT 45K DRAG Daily Total: $ 77,698
17:00 18:30 1.5 L/D 2-STABALIZERS & BIT P/U NEW BIT FUNCTION BLIND & PIPE RAMS Cum. Witr: $ 61,850
18:30 0:30 6.0 T..H. TO CSG SHOE INSTALL ROT. HEAD - BREAK CIRC @ 5000’ & 7500' Cum. Fuel $ 203,904
0:30 1:30 1.0 WASH & REAM 90' TO BTM Cum. Bits: $ 57,880
1:30 6.00 4.5 DRLG FR 9980' - 10023' @ 9.67HR
RECEIVED BHA
a |BIT/B.S. |lea. 5.00
APR16-2008 65D.C. | 1 31.06
s e 6.5 Monel 1 9.12
DIV-OF Ot GAS T MINING 5.5 DC p 3107
6.5D.C. 1 31.01
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go] 6.5 D.C. 17 528.01
Wasatch 3682' 0' Mancos 11537 1514'|HWDP 3 92.18
|Mesaverde 8002' 0' Frontier 11815 1792'|IDRLG JARS | 1 31.70
Castlegate 10442' 419' Dakota 16142' 6119'HWDP 18 551.85
Desert 10662’ 639" TD 16440’ 6417
Grassy 10982 959 o' o'
Sunnyside 11262’ 1239 0 O'JTOTAL BHA = 1311.00
Kenilworth 11262’ 1239 4} 0'}Survey 9959 9.0/199
24.00 JAberdeen 11462' 1439’ BOILERl 12/480T [Survey
P/U 255K FLARE DRLG: NO Degasser NO BKG GAS 18-30 units
S/O0 220K FLARE TRIP: NO Gas Buster NO CONN GAS 36 units
ROT. 237K LAST CSG.RAN: 9 5/8 SET@ 4999’ KB PEAK GAS 227 units
FUEL Used: 1500 On Hand: 7200 Co.Man J.D. ALLEN TRIP GAS 67 units
BIT # 10 ICS OoCS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP
| CONDITION 0 1 WT s X IN cT PR




GASCO
Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

TUS RISE s~/

Ys—013~ 3;; ©8s~

CHTE Cya’

TIGHT HOLE

AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500' | Prog.Depth 16500" DATE 4/21/08 DAYS: 30
Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD @ 10473’
Depth:  10473' |Progress 122 |orill Hrs: 201/2 |av Rop: 6.0 |rormation: LOWER MESAVERDE
DMC: $4,079 TMC: $158,441 TDC: $29,719 JCWC: $2,442,244
Contractor: NABORS 169 lMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
[Mw: 9.4 #1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 lBit #: 12 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 48 IsPMm: 65 ISize: 77/8 Isurf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PV/YP: 16/12 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FMHX753ZR Int. Csg: $ - Day Work $ 19,500
Gel: 14/27/34 |sPm: 65 JMFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,950
(WL: 12 GPM : 450 lSIN: 11135036 |Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 2300 Jets: 3/16 3/15 (Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Isolids: 7.6 AV DC: 558 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ -
IMBT 10 AV DP: 149 Depth In: 10351 Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.0 JetVel: 13 JFTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
PfIMf: .025/5.65 JECD: 10.26 Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: 3$ -
Chlor: 8400 |SPR #1: 30stk 220psi _|FPH: Heater: 3 - |sits: $ -
Ca : 20 ISPR #2: 30stk 220 psi jwos: JPumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 7 IBtm.Up: 43 R-RPM: IPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 75
Time Break Down: Total D.T.  |M-RPM: IMisc: cMT $ - |consuitant: $ 1,300
START END TIME /304.5 TOTAL I Total Rot. Hrs: 384.5 lDain Total: $ - |prilling Mud: $ 4,079
6:00 8:30 2.5 T.l.H. & FILL PIPE Misc. / Labor: $ -
8:30 9:00 0.5 WASH & REAM 90' TO BTM Csg. Crew: $ -
9:00 4:00 19.0 DRLG FR 10351 - 10468' @ 6.2/HR Daily Total: $ 29,719
4:00 4:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE - SERVICE TOP DRIVE Cum. Wir: $ 65412
4:30 6:00 1.5 DRLG FR 10468' - 10473' @ 3.3/HR Cum. Fuel $ 258,345
Cum. Bits: $ 90,880
RECEIVED BHA
|siT/BS. llea. 5.00
APRmUUs TORK BUST} 1 2.23
6.5 D.C. 1 31.06
UV, UF O'L, GAS & MIN'NG 6.5 Monel 1 9.12
6.5 DC 1 31.07
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go}6.5 D.C. 1 31.01
Wasatch 3682' 0' Mancos 11537’ 1064'] 6.5 D.C. 17 528.01
Mesaverde 8002 0' Frontier 11815' 1342'|HWDP 3 92.18
Castlegate 10442' 0' Dakota 16142’ 5669'|pRLG JARS | 1 31.70
Desert 10662' 189' TD 16440’ 5967'|HWDP 18 551.85
Grassy 10982 509' o' 0'
Sunnyside 11262 789 o' O'ITOTAL BHA = 1313.23
Kenilworth 11262' 789' o' 0'|Survey 7/198 10245'
24.00 |Aberdeen 11462' 989" BOILERI 12 /516T |Survey
| (1Y) 295K FLARE DRLG: NO Degasser NO BKG GAS 23-40 units
S/0 220K FLARE TRIP: NO Gas Buster NO CONN GAS 100 units
IROT. 245K LAST CSG.RAN: 9 5/8 SET@ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 255 units
IFUEL Used: 2100 On Hand: 9150 Co.Man J.D. ALLEN TRIP GAS N/A
BIT # 11 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP
| CONDITION 2 4 WT A X IN BT PR
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GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

TS RISE s—16b

L/B —0l3~3 36%5

GRTE CYV g

TIGHT HOLE

AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500' | Prog.Depth 16500' DATE 4/22/08 DAYS: 31
Current: Operations: T.ILH. WITH BIT #13
Depth: 10531’ lProgress 58 IDriII Hrs: 9 IAV ROP: 6.4 IFormation: CASTLEGATE
DMC: $4,455 ITMC: $162,896 TDC: $51,000 Jcwc: $2,493,244
Contractor: NABORS 169 lMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
|mw: 9.4 #1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit # 12 13 Conductor: $ - |roc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 46 SPM: 65 Size: 778 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 15/14 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FMHX753ZR | HC506ZX+ |int. Csg: $ - Day Work $ 19,500
Gel: 14/28/37 |spm: 65 MFG: SECURITY | HUGHES |prod csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,950
WL 11.2  |erPm: 450 Ism: 11135036 7011909  |Float Equp: $ - |trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 2300 Jets: 3/16 3/15 6/16's Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
solids: 7 AV DC: 553 TD Out: 10531 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fue: $ -
[MBT 10 AV DP: 148 Depth In: 10351 10531 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.3 JetVel: 129 FTG: 180 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
PfIME: .025/5.5 |eco: 10.02 Hrs: 29.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chilor: 7700 |sPra#1: 30stk 220psi _ |rPH: 6.1 Heater: $ - |Bits: $ 17,310
Ca : 20 SPR #2 : 30stk 220 psi jwos: 32 PumpingLIT:  $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 7 Btm.Up: 44 R-RPM: 45/65 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 75
Time Break Down: Total D.T.  [M-RPM: N/A Jmisc: cmT $ - |consultant: $ 1,300
START END TIME /304.5 TOTAL I Total Rot. Hrs: 393.5 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 4,455
6:00 15:00 9.0 DRLG FR 10473’ - 10531' @ 6.4/HR Misc. / Labor: $ 3,595
15:00 15:30 0.5 MIX & PUMP DRY JOB Csg. Crew: $ -
15:30 20:00 45 T.0.0H. TOBHA 50K DRAG Daily Total: $ 51,000
20:00 0:30 4.5 INSPECT HW.D.P. & DRILL COLLARS Cum. Wir: $ 65412
0:30 2:00 1.5 L/D BIT, TORQUE BUSTER, MONEL / P/U BIT & NEW MONEL Cum. Fuel $ 258,345
2:00 3:00 1.0 RIG SERVICE - SERVICE TOP DRIVE - CHANGE DIES ON TOP DRIVE GRABBER Cum. Bits: $ 102,880
3:00 6:00 3.0 T.1H. TO CSG SHOE
(Y ml Y mnd A W J el i
T L TV IL) BHA
Apn Vi Y 2{]08 BIT/BS. [|1ea. 1.00
) BIT SUB 1 4.00
DIV OF OlL, GAS & MINING 6500, |1 31.06
6.5 Monel 1 10.09
6.5D.C. 19 590.09
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To GoJHWDP 3 92.18
Wasatch 3682’ 0' Mancos 11537 1006'|prLG JARS | 1 31.70
Mesaverde 8002 0' Frontier 11815 1284'|HWDP 18 551.85
Castlegate 10241' 0' Dakota 16142’ 5611’
Desert 10661’ 130' TD 16440 5909’
Grassy 10982' 451’ 0 0
Sunnyside 11262 731 o 0'JTOTAL BHA = 1311.97
Kenilworth 11262 7371 0 0'{Survey
24.00 |aberdeen 11462 931’ BOILER| 12/528T [survey
P/U 295K FLARE DRLG: NO Degasser NO BKG GAS 20-35 units
S/0 220K FLARE TRIP: NO Gas Buster NO CONN GAS 36 units
ROT. 245K LAST CSG.RAN: 9 5/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 52 units
FUEL Used: 1500 On Hand: 7650 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS N/A
BIT # 12 ICS oCs DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP
| CONDITION 2 2 WT A X IN CT PR




Energy

TS R1sE 51

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Y3~0/3—~ 3

BH65. 5

TIGHT HOLE

AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500" | Prog.Depth 16500’ DATE 4/23/08 DAYS: 32
Current: Operations: DRILLING TO
Depth:  10661' |Progress 130 |Drill Hrs: 111/2  |avRrop: 113 [Formation: CASTLEGATE
DMC: $2,081 T™C: $164,977 TDC: $27,721 |CWC: $2,520,965
Contractor: NABORS 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Mw: 9.5  |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit #: 12 13 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 49 SPM: 65 Size: 77/8 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - |Rrig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 17/14 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FMHX753ZR | HC506ZX+ |int. Csg: $ - Day Work $ 19,500
Gel: 14/23/31 |spm: 65 |MFG: SECURITY HUGHES |prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 3,950
wL: 12 GPM : 450 ISIN: 11135036 7011909 [Fioat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 2200 Jets: 3/16 3/15 6/16's Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 8.5 |avoc: 553 TD Out: 10531 10661 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
ImBT 10 AV DP: 148 Depth In: 10351 10531 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.3 JetVel: 129 FTG: 180 130 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
PH/MS: .025/5.35 Jecp: 10.02 Hrs: 29.5 11.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 7200 |sPr#1: 30stk 180 psi |FPH: 6.1 11.3 Heater: $ - |Bits:
Ca : 20 SPR #2 : 30stk 190 psi  jwoB: 32 10/32 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 6.5 Btm.Up: 44 R-RPM: 45/65 50/70 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 75
Time Break Down: Total D.T.  |M-RPM: N/A N/A |misc: cur $ - |consultant: $ 1,300
START END TIME /304.5 TOTAL | Total Rot. Hrs: 405.0 IDain Total: $ - |prilling Mud: $ 2,081
6:00 7:00 1.0 TIH T/5029" Misc. / Labor:
7:00 8:30 1.5 CHANGE ROTATING HEAD RUBBER. FUNCTION UPPER & LOWER PIPE RAMS, BREAK CIRC. - TEST SURVEJCsg. Crew: $ -
8:30 10:30 2.0 TIH F/5029' T/10307" Daily Total: $ 27,721
10:30 12:00 1.5 WASH & REAM F/10307' T/10532' Cum. Wtr: $ 65412
12:00 13:00 1.0 DRLG F/10532' T/10563' 31' @ 31 FPH Cum. Fuel $ 258,345
13:00 13:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE Cum. Bits: $ 102,880
13:30 23:00 9.5 DRLG F/10563' T/10660" 97' @ 10.2 FPH
23:00 | 23:30 05  |SURVEY - COULD NOT PUMP UP SURVEY CERNER
23:30 | 00:30 1.0 |DRLG Fr0660' TH0661" 1 @ 2 FPH bl BHA
00:30 | 1:00 0.5 |ATTEMPT SURVEY - NO GO APR 7 3 2008 BIT/BS. |lea. 1.00
1:00 | 1:30 05 |PUMP DRY SLUG ersus | 1 4.00
1:30 | 400 2.5 |TOOH T/5000° DIV. OF OIL, GAS& MINING __|s5pc. | 1 31.06
4:00 4:30 0.5 PULL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER 6.5 Monel 1 — 10.09
4:30 6:00 1.5 TOOH 6.5D.C. 19 590.09
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To GoJHWDP 3 92.18
Wasatch 3682' 0' Mancos 11537 876'|DRLG JARS 31.70
Mesaverde 8002’ 0' Frontier 11815’ 1154'|HWDP 18 551.85
Castlegate 10241 0' Dakota 16142 5481'
Desert 10661' 0 TD 16440’ 5779'
Grassy 10982 321" 0 0'
Sunnyside 11262' 601" o O'|TOTAL BHA = 1311.97
Kenilworth 11262' 601’ o 0'|Survey
24.00 |Aberdeen 11462 801" BOILER| 12/540T |survey
P/U 295K FLARE DRLG: NO Degasser NO BKG GAS 25-45 units
S/0 220K FLARE TRIP: NO Gas Buster NO CONN GAS 58 units
ROT. 245K LAST CSG.RAN: 9 5/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 117 units
FUEL Used: 1500 On Hand: 6150 Co.Man ROBERT CHAMBERLIN TRIP GAS 76
BIT # 12 ICS 0oCs DC LOC B/S G oDC RP
| CONDITION 2 2 WT A X IN CT PR




GASC

7S RisE S—A

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

U703~ 33685~
TIGHT HOLE

Energy
ner AFE # 40104 B 1550 240002
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth  16500" | Prog.Depth 16500’ DATE 4/24/08 DAYS: 33
Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD @ 10793'
Depth: 10793’ IProgress 132 lDriII Hrs: 81/2 IAV ROP: 15.5 IFormation: BLACKHAWK
DMC: $1,712 ITMC: $166,689 TDC: $104,833 JCwWC: $2,625,798
Contractor: NABORS 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Mw: 9.6 #1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Bit #: 13 14 Conductor: $ - |roc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 42 SPM: 65 Size: 77/8 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 13/10 [#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: HC506ZX+ HC506ZX+ |int. Csq: $ - Day Work $ 19,500
Gel: 6/18/25 |spm: 65 IMFG: HUGHES HUGHES |prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 3,950
WL: 14.2  |cpm: 450 SIN: 7011909 7116462 |Fioat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ 8,347
Cake: 2 Press: 2200 Jets: 6/16's 6/16's Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
{Solids: 9 AV DC: 553 TD Out: 10661 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ 30,134
IMBT 10 AV DP: 148 Depth In: 10531 10661 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.0 JetVel: 129 FTG: 130 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
Pf/IMf: .02/4.8 JECD: 10.23 Hrs: 11.5 8.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ =
Chlor: 6000 ISPR #: 30stk 180 psi |FpH: 11.3 Heater: $ - |Bits: $ 39,000
Ca : 20 ISPR #2: 30stk 190 psi |wos: 10/32 2/25 Pumping LIT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 6.5 |Btm.Up: 44 R-RPM: 50/70 55/65 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 75
Time Break Down: Total D.T.  |M-RPM: N/A N/A Jmisc: cmr $ - |consuitant: $ 1,300
START END TIME /304.5 TOTAL | Total Rot. Hrs: 413.5- IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 1,712
6:00 8:00 2.0 TOOH Misc. / Labor:
8:00 9:30 1.5 TOOH W/ BHA LD SURVEY TOOL, BREAK BIT Csg. Crew: $ -
9:30 11:00 1.5 MU BIT, NEW SURVEY TOOL. CHECK DRLG LINE ON DRUM - BAD AREA Daily Total: $ 104,833
11:00 11:30 0.5 HANG BLOCKS Cum. Wir: $ 65412
11:30 12:30 1.0 JCUT 533 OF DRLG LINE Cum. Fuel $ 258,345
12:30 13:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG Cum. Bits: $ 102,880
13.00 16:00 3.0 TIH T/2500' BREAK CIRCULATION - TEST SURVEY TOOL - OK
16:00 17:00 1.0 TIH T/ 5029’ FILL PIPE
17:00 18:00 1.0 INSTALL ROTATING HEAD ASSEMBLY BHA
18:00 20:00 2.0 TIH 7/10,276 BIT/B.S. |lea. 1.00
20.00 21:00 1.0 WASH/REAM 5 STANDS DOWN TO 10,661’ BIT SUB 1 4.00
21:00 2:30 5.5 BREAK IN BIT. DRLG - F/10661' T/10'754' 93' @ 17 FPH 6.5D.C. 1 31.06
2:30 3:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE 6.5 Monel 1 10.09
3:00 6:00 3.0 DRLG F/10754' T/10793' 39' @ 13 FPH 6.5D.C. 19 590.09
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To GoJHWDP 3 92.18
[ o Wasatch 3682 0' Mancos 11537 744'IDRLG JARS | 1 31.70
cu E'—‘VE D Mesaverde 8002’ 0' Frontier 11815 1022'|HWDP 18 551.85
PR 2 4_2998 Castlegate 10241 0' Dakota 16142 5349
Desert 10661' -132' TD 16440’ 5647
NV _OEOL_oAcle paminn |Grassy 10982 189" o o
S T R R Sunnyside 11262' 469’ 0 0'ITOTAL BHA = 1311.97
Kenilworth 11262 469 o' 0'|Survey 10503 5.6/197
24.00 |Aberdeen 11462 669' BOILERI 12 /552T |Survey 10694| 6.1/181
P/U 295K FLARE DRLG: NO Degasser NO BKG GAS 20-40 units
S/0 220K FLARE TRIP: NO Gas Buster  NO CONN GAS 69 units
ROT. 245K LAST CSG.RAN: 9 5/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 160 units
FUEL Used: 1650 On Hand: 12250 Co.Man ROBERT CHAMBERLIN TRIP GAS 60
BIT # 13 ICS 0OCS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP
| CONDITION 3 2 CT N X IN CT PR
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GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

TS k I5FE s

Y3-013—33 b g5

TIGHT H H6’EE

AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500’ Prog.Depth 16500° DATE 4/28/08 DAYS: 37
Current: Operations: DRLG
Depth: 11311’ IProgress 183 IDriII Hrs: 10 IAV ROP: 18.3 IFormation: KENILWORTH
DMC: $4,843 lT™c: $183,466 TDC: $32,068 |cwc: $2,767,403
Contractor: lMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Jmw: 9.9 J#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Bit #: 16 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 43  {spm: 65 Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 11/13 |42 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FMH3555Z Int. Csg: $ - |pay work $ 19,500
Gel: 12/27/32)spm: 65 |MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: 3 - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
WL: 17 GPM : 450 SIN: 10963127 |Fioat Equp: $ - Trucking:
Cake: 2 Press: 2700 Jets: 5-16'S Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 9.7 lavpoc: 553 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuek
IMBT 7.5 Javoe: 148 Depth In: 11128 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.1 JetVel: 129 FTG: 183 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
PfIMf: .02/4.5 [ecp: 10.23 Hrs: 10 |Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 6000 IsPR#1: 30stk 200 psi |FpH: 18.3 Heater: $ - |Bits:
Ca : 20 |sPR#2: 30stk 220 psi Jwos: 15-20 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,575
Dapp ppb: 6.5 |Btm.up: 44 R-RPM: 30-40 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 75
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 72 |misc: cmT $ - |cConsultant: $ 1,300
START END TIME /304.5 TOTAL I Total Rot. Hrs: : 471;0 : vIDaily Total: $ - Drifling Mud: $ 4,843
6:00 6:30 0.5 CHANGE ROTATING HEAD RUBBER Misc. / Labor:
6:30 | 8:30 2.0  |ToOH w/BHA. BREAK BIT/BIT SUB. % p= S E kY P F.
8:30 9:00 0.5 PULL - TURN WEAR BUSHING 180" nkALEIVED
9:00 10:30 1.5 CUT DRLG LINE - 102’ A_PR_Z_g_zg%
10:30 11:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: $ -
11:00 | 13:30 2.5  |TIH W/BHA. MU MOTOR, BIT i AE Pl AAG 0 LAALALA Daily Total: $ 32,068
TITF W Wy NAPW GOV YT
13:30 | 15:30 2.0 TIH 1/5154" Cum. Wtr: $ 65,412
15:30 16:00 0.5 CHANGE ROTATING HEAD RUBBER. Cum. Fuel $ 258,345
16:00 16:30 0.5 BREAK CIRCULATION. CHECK FOR FLOW - OK. Cum. Bits: $ 102,880
16:30 | 19:00 25 TIH T/10973' BHA
19:00 19:30 0.5 REAM 2 STDS DOWN - NO FILL BIT 1 1.00
19:30 3:30 8.0 DRLG F/11128' T/11258' 130' @ 16.2 FPH MOTOR 1 32.89
3:30 4.00 0.5 RIG SERVICE 6.5 Monel 1 10.09
4:00 6:00 2.0 DRLG F/11258' T/11311' 53' @ 26.5 FPH 6.5 SDC 20 621.15
HWDP 3 92.18
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To GoJDRLG JARS 1 31.70
Wasatch 3681 0' Mancos 11537 226'|HWDP 18 551.85
[Mesaverde 8002’ 0' Frontier 11815’ 504'
Castlegate 10418’ 0' Dakota 16142 4831’
|Desert 10661 0'TD 16440’ 5129’
Grassy 10841' 0' 0 0'
Sunnyside 10981 o' o' 0'JTOTAL BHA = 1340.86
Kenilworth 11261' 0 o' 0'|Survey 4.6/207 11103’
24.00 |Aberdeen 11461 150 BOlLERI 12 /600T |Survey 4.4/211 11198’
PIU 300K FLARE DRLG: NO Degasser NO BKG GAS 60 - 300
S/IO 220K FLARE TRIP: NO Gas Buster NO CONN GAS 2003
ROT. 250K LAST CSG.RAI 9 5/8 SET@ 4999° KB PEAK GAS 1879
lFUEL Used: 1350 On Hand: 6000 Co.Man ROBERT CHAMBERLIN TRIP GAS 113
BIT # 16 | ICS 0OCS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP

I CONDITION




TUS RisE s

GASC GASCO ENERGY J2-o13 ;32695
FW DAILY DRILLING REPORT TIéﬁT 6IE
nergy AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth  16500° | Prog.Depth 16500' DATE 4/29/08 DAYS: 38
Current: Operations: DRLG
Depth: 11929’ IProgress 618 lDriH Hrs: 23 IAV ROP: 26.9 IFormation: MANCOS
DMC: $11,653 1TMC: $195,119 TDC: $58,903 |cwc: $2,826,306
Contractor: IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
mw: 10.2  |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Bit #: 16 Conductor: $ - lioc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 52  |spm: 65 Isize: 77/8 fsurt. Csg: $ - |Rrig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 14/20 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FMH35552 Int. Csg: $ - Day Work $ 19,500
Gel: 12/28/38|spPm: 65 JMFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - Rentat Tools: $ 3,960
WL: 16.4 |jcPM: 450 lsm: 10963127 {Float Equp: $ - |rrucking:
Cake: 2 Press: 2900 Jets: 5-16'S Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 13  Javoce: 553 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuer
IMBT 10 Javop: 148 Depth In: 11128 Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.0 JetVel: 129 FTG: 801 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
PfIMf: .02/4.9 [eco: 10.84 Hrs: 33 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 6200 |sPr#1: 30stk 340 psi _|FPH: 18.3 Heater: $ - |Bits: $ 18,000
Ca : 40 |sPr#2: 30stk 350 psi _jwos: 25-32 JPumping LT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 3,600
Dapp ppb: 6 {Btm.Up: 48 R-RPM: 30-40 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 75
Time Break Down: Total D.T.  [M-RPM: 72 Jmisc: cmT $ - |consuttant: $ 1,300
START END TIME /304.5 TOTAL I Total Rot. Hrs: 494,00 :IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 11,653
6:00 8.00 2.0 DRLG F/11311' T/11353' 42' @ 21 FPH Misc. / Labor:
8:00 8:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE, SPR'S @ 9.7 PPG Ing. Crew: $ -
8:30 0:00 15.5 DRLG F/11353' T/11737" 384’ @ 24.8 FPH Daily Total: $ 58,903
0:00 0:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE
0:30 6:00 5.5 {DRLG F/11737' T/11929' 192' @ 34.9 FPH Cum. Wtr: $ 65412
Cum. Fuel $ 258,345
Cum. Bits: $ 102,880
RECEIVED
BHA
PR 7 9 2008 BIT 1 1.00
o MOTOR 1 32.89
Oi-OE QIL, GAS & MINING 6.5 Monel 1 10.09
6.5 SDC 20 621.15
fHWDP 3 92.18
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To GoJDRLG JARS 1 31.70
Wasatch 3681 0' Mancos 11637 0'[HWDP 18 551.85
Mesaverde 8002’ 0' Frontier 11815 0'
Castlegate 10418’ 0' Dakota 16142’ 4213
Desert 10661 0' TD 16440’ 4511°
Grassy 10841' 0' o' 0'
Sunnyside 10981 0 o' O'|TOTAL BHA = 1340.86
Kenilworth 11261 0 o' 0'}Survey 5.5/187 11515’
24.00 |Aberdeen 11461 -468' BOILERI 12 /612T |Survey 6.2/195 11707
P/U 325K FLARE DRLG: &' Degasser YES BKG GAS 125-200
S/0 210K FLARE TRIP: NO Gas Buster YES CONN GAS 839
ROT. 260K LAST CSG.RAI 9 5/8 SET @ 4999" KB PEAK GAS 4172
FUEL Used: 1800 On Hand: 4200 Co.Man ROBERT CHAMBERLIN TRIP GAS NA
BIT # 16 | ICS OCSs DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP

| CONDITION




GASC(:
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GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

TS rise s

7
TIEHT HOLE

AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500’ Prog.Depth 16500’ DATE 4/30/08 DAYS: 39
Current: Operations: DRLG
Depth:  12862' |Progress 933 |orin vrs: 22 |av rRoP: 424 |Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $11,653 ITMC: $201,592 TDC: $67,984 |cwc: $2,894,290
Contractor: IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
|mw: 10.5 J#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 lBit # 16 Conductor: $ - |LoccCost: $ -
vis: 51 |spm: 60 Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 15/19 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FMH3555Z Int. Csg: $ - Day Work $ 19,500
Gel: 14/30/38]spm: 60 IMFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
WL: 15.2 |ePm: 422 SIN: 10963127 |Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 1 ,21 1
Cake: 2 Press: 2900 Jets: 5-16'S Well Head: $ - Water: $ 3,791
|soiids: 15.5 Javbc: 523 D Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ 27,259
IMBT 7.5 {avoe: 179 Depth In: 11128 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.0 JetVel: 137 |FTG: 1734 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
PTIMf: .01/4.6 {ecp: 11.02 Hrs: 55 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 5500 [sPr#1: 30stk 390 psi |FPH: 31.5 Heater: $ - |Bits:
Ca : 20 SPR #2 : 30stk 360 psi jwos: 25-32 {Pumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ 3,600
Dapp ppb: 5 {Btm.Up: 56 R-RPM: 30-40 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 75
Time Break Down: Total D.T.  |M-RPM: 67 $ - |consultant: $ 1,300
START END TIME /304.5 TOTAL I Total Rot. Hrs: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 6,473
6:00 14:00 8.0 DRLG F/11928' T/12216' 288" @ 36 FPH Misc. / Labor:
14:00 14:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE Ing.Crew: $ -
14:30 18:00 35 DRLG F/12216' T/12370" 154' @ 44 FPH Daily Total: $ 67,984
18:00 19:00 1.0 CHANGE PUMP SWAB & REPAIR ROD CLAMP
19:00 | 23:30 4.5 DRLG F/12370' T/12598' 228' @ 50.7 FPH Cum. Wir: $ 65412
23:30 0:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE Cum. Fuel $ 258,345
0:00 6:00 6.0 DRLG F/12598' T/12862' 264’ @ 44 FPH Cum. Bits: $ 102,880
P UEIVED BHA
vy i IBIT 1 1.00
APRTWUUB |moTor 1 32.89
NIV AL AL~ 6.5 Monel 1 10.09
YIS UAS S MINING 6.5 SDC 20 621.15
HWDP 3 92.18
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go]DRLG JARS 31.70
Wasatch 3681' 0' Mancos 115637 0'jlHwDP 18 551.85
Mesaverde 8002’ 0' Frontier 11815 0'
Castlegate 10418’ 0" Dakota 16142 3280’
Desert 10661' 0'TD 16440' 3578'
Grassy 10841' 0 0 0
Sunnyside 10981' 0' o' 0'JTOTAL BHA = 1340.86
Kenilworth 11261 0 [} 0'[Survey 5.8/202 12568’
24.00 |Aberdeen 11461’ -1401' BOILERI 12 /624T |Survey 5.9/192] 12759
P/U 325K FLARE DRLG: 3'-20' Degasser YES BKG GAS 45-200
S/0 210K FLARE TRIP: NO Gas Buster YES CONN GAS 385
ROT. 260K LAST CSG.RAI 9 5/8 SET@ 4999 KB PEAK GAS 267
FUEL Used: 1900  On Hand: 8850 Co.Man ROBERT CHAMBERLIN TRIP GAS NA
BIT # 16 | ICS 0OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

| CONDITION




GASCO
Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
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Ya-013- 336
G ATE CYAV 54~ gs”

TIGHT HOLE

AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500' | Prog.Depth 16500’ DATE 5/1/08 DAYS: 40
Current: Operations: TOOH
Depth: 12862 IProgress 694 |Drill Hrs: 19 IAV ROP: 36.5 IFormation: MANCOS
DMC: $4,528 |TMC: $206,120 TDC: $33,778 |cwc: $2,928,068
Contractor: IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Jaw: 10.8 [J#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 lBit #: 16 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
Vis: 50 |spm: 55 Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 11/27 |42 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FMH3555Z fint. Csg: $ - |pay work $ 19,500
Gel: 13/31/40]spPm: 55 IMFG: SECURITY IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
WL 14.8 |cem: 384 |sm: 10963127 {FostEaup:  $ - rrucking:
Cake: 2 Press: 3100 Jets: 6-16's Well Head: $ - |water:
1solids: 17.8 javoc: 475 7D Out: 13556 TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel:
IMBT 10 AV DP: 127 Depth In: 11128 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 79 JetVel: 125 FTG: 2428 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
PfIMf: .02/4.3 |eco: 11.24 Hrs: 74 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 5000 |sPR#1: 30stk 390 psi JrPH: 32.8 Heater: $ - Bits:
Ca : 20 |sPr#2: 30stk 360 psi jwos: 25-32 {Pumping LIT: $ - {Mud Motors: $ 3,600
Dapp ppb: 6.5 |Btm.Up: 65.2 R-RPM: 20-40 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 75
Time Break Down: Total D.T.  |M-RPM: 67 Misc: CMT $ - |consutant: $ 1,300
START END TIME /304.5 TOTAL l Total Rot. Hrs: ; Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,528
6:00 14:00 8.0 DRLG F/12862' T/13173" 311' @ 38.9 FPH Misc. / Labor:
14:00 14:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE Ing. Crew: $ -
14:30 1:00 10.5 DRLG F/13173' T/13,553' 380' @ 36.2 FPH Daily Total: $ 33,778
1:00 1:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE
1:30 2:00 0.5 DRLG F/13553' T/13556' 3' @ 6 FPH Cum. Wir: $ 69,203
2:00 3:30 1.5 CIRC. BOTTOMS UP Cum. Fuel $ 315,738
3:30 6:00 2.5 PUMP/BACK REAM OUT OF HOLE Cum. Bits: $ 102,880
REGENVED
BHA
MAY 01 2008 BIT 1 1.00
MOTOR 1 32.89
DIV.QF OIL, GAS & MINING 6.5 Monel 1 10.09
6.5 SDC 20 621.15
HWDP 3 92.18
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go]DRLG JARS 31.70
Wasatch 3681’ 0' Mancos 115637' 0'fHWDP 18 551.85
Mesaverde 8002' 0' Frontier 11815' 0'
Castlegate 10418' 0' Dakota 16142’ 3280
Desert 10661' 0'TD 16440’ 3578
Grassy 10841 0' o' 0'
Sunnyside 10981’ 0 o' O'JTOTAL BHA = 1340.86
Kenilworth 11261 [} o' 0'|Survey 6.1/189 13143’
24.00 |Aberdeen 11461 -1401" BOILERl 12 /636T |Survey 6.1/188 13334
PIU 330K FLARE DRLG: 3'-15' Degasser YES BKG GAS 30-240
/0 210K FLLARE TRIP: NO Gas Buster YES CONN GAS 280
ROT. 270K LAST CSG.RA| 9 5/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 350
JFUEL Used: 1650 On Hand: 7200 Co.Man ROBERT CHAMBERLIN TRIP GAS NA
BIT # 16 | ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

[ CONDITION
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AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500" | Prog.Depth 16500" DATE 5/2/08 DAYS: 41
Current: Operations: TOOH

lbeptn:  13556' lProgress 0 |oritt Hrs: 0 |av ROP: #DIV/O!  |Formation: MANCOS

lomc: $3,442 [tmc: $209,562 TDC: $43.012 Jowe: $2,971,080
Contractor: |Mud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

[mw: 10.9 |g1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 an #: 16 17 Conductor: $ - lLoc,Cost: $ -
vis: 60 |spm: Size: 77/8 778 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 20/20 §#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FMH3555Z FM3655ZZ |int. Csg: $ - Day Work $ 19,500
Gel: 12/24/33§spMm: JMFG: SECURITY | SECURITY |prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
WL: 13.8 JePMm: |sm: 10963127 10862476 |Fioat Equp: $ - |Trucking:

Cake: 2 Press: Jets: 5-16's 7-16'S  |well Head: $ - |water:

Isolids: 15.9 Javoc: TD Out: 13556 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet:

[mer 10 __Javoe: Depth In: 11128 13556  |Packers: $ - |MudLogger: $ 815
PH : 7.8  |uetvel: FTG: 2428 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
PfIMF: .02/4.2 [ecp: Hrs: 74 Separator: $ - |cement: $ -
Chior: 4800 |sPr#1: FPH: 32.8 Heater: $ - |sits: $ 10,500
Ca : 20 |sPr#2: woB: 25-32 25-32 Pumping LIT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 1,200
Dapp ppb: 6 |Btm.Up: R-RPM: 20-40 30-40 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 75

Time Break Down: Total D.T.  |M-RPM: 67 72 |Misc: cmT $ - |consuitant: $§ 1,300
START | END TIME /304.5 TOTAL | Total Rot. Hrs: §35.0 IDaIIy Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 3,442
6:00 7:30 1.5 CONTINUE BACKREAMING WITH PUMPS ON T/11320'. PULL BACKREAMING Misc. / Labor: $ 2,220
BUT WITHOUT PUMP T/11160". Csg. Crew: $ -
COULD NOT PULL OFF OF BOTTOM FOR TRIP. HAD TO PUMP OUT & BACK REAM |Daily Total: $ 43,012
OUT OF HOLE DUE TO RIG NOT HAVING THE POWER TO PULL OFF OF BOTTOM
WITHOUT PUMP PRESSURE AND BACK REAMING TO ASSIST. CLUTCH WOULD Cum. Wtr: $ 69,203
SLIP AND/OR DRAWWORKS WOULD POWER OUT WHEN ATTEMPTING TO PULL Cum. Fuel $ 315,738
OFF OF BOTTOM. Jcum. Bits: $ 113,380
7:30 8:00 0.5 PUMP DRY PILL.
8:00 | 11:30 3.5 |TOOH T/ SHOE @ 5000" RECEIVED
11:30 | 12.00 | 05 |PuLL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER. —-
12:00 | 1500 | 3.0  froon MAY (2 2008
15:00 | 16:00 1.0 |lpBHA '
16:00 19:00 3.0 PULL WEAR BUSHING. OPEN BOP DOORS. CHANGE LOWER 4 1/2 RAMS TO VBR'S. TEST TOP DRIVE. NV AEAL O AS—&-M'I'N',NG-
19:00 | 20:00 | 1.0 |rEsTBOPE. itk
20:00 | 22:30 2.5 REPAIR HIGH PRESSURE GREASE ZERK ON BOTTOM OF DOUBLE RAM. BHA
22:30 23:00 0.5 PULL TEST PLUG. RIG DOWN TESTER - B&C QUICK TEST ONC. BIT 1 1.00
23:00 23:30 0.5 INSTALL NEW WEAR BUSHING {MOTOR 1 32.93
23:30 1:30 2.0 PU MOTOR, SURVEY TOOL, MU BIT TIH W/ BHA 6.5 Monel 1 10.08
1:30 6:00 4.5 TIH 6.5 SDC 20 621.15
HWDP 3 92.18
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go|DRLG JARS 1 31.70
Wasatch 3681 0' Mancos 11837 0'|JHWDP 18 551.85
|Mesaverde 8002' 0' Frontier 11815 o'
Castlegate 10418’ 0' Dakota 16142 2586’
Desert 10661" 0' 1D 16440 2884’
Grassy 10841' 0 0 0"
Sunnyside 10981' 0 0' 0'|TOTAL BHA = 1340.89
|Kenilworth 11261" 0 0 0'|Survey
24.00 |Aberdeen 11461 -2095' BOILER| 12/648T [Survey
P/U 330K FLARE DRLG: Degasser BKG GAS
S/0 210K FLARE TRIP: NO Gas Buster CONN GAS
ROT. 270K LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET@ 4999' KB PEAK GAS
I@. Used: 1800 On Hand: 5400 Co.Man ROBERT CHAMBERLIN TRIP GAS NA
BIT # 16 ] ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP
| CONDITION 1 2 CT S X IN WT PR
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RKB 25 AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500° | Prog.Depth 16500' DATE 5/6/08 DAYS: 45
Current: Operations: DOWN TIME; TRIP OUT TO SHOE
Ipepth:  13556' JProgress 0 Iorig Hrs: 0 |av roP: #DIV/O!  Jrormation: MANCOS
Jowme: $8,972 |tmc: $249,359 TDC: $15,707 |cwe: $3,079,531
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
TMw: 11.1  J#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBIt #: 17 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 47  |sPm: 45 Size: 77/8 Isurf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 17/14 [#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FM3655Z7Z Int. Csg: $ - Day Work $ -
Gel: 9/24/31 {spm: 45 jMFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
wL: 17 Jepm: 314 |sm: 10862476 Float Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 3 Press: 1300 Jets: 7-16'S Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
ISolids: 16.2 |avoc: 389 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel: $ -
IMBT 10 AV DP: 104 Depth In: 13556 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.0 Letvel: 102 FTG: 0 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
PfIME: .1/5.00 Jecp: 11.14 Hrs: 0 |Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 4200 JsPr#1: FPH: #DIV/O! Heater: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca : 40 ISPR #2 woB: Pumping L/T: $ - |mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: | 6.6 IBtm.Up: 79.6 R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - |camp $ 535
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |m-RPM: Mmisc: cmr $ - |consuiltant: $ 1,350
START | END TIME 399.5 | Total Rot. Hrs: '535.0  |aiy Totar $ - |Driling Mua: $ 8972
6:00 18:00 12:00  |DOWN TIME; FINISH STAGE IN HOLE Misc. / Labor: $ -
18:00 6:00 12:00 DOWN TIME; TRY TO MAKE SHORT TRIP ( CAN'T GET OFF BOTTOM, HAVE TO Csg. Crew: $ -
6:00 PUMP AND ROTATE 15 STDS. TO GET OUT TO THE SHOE ).WAIT ON LOW DRUM AND CLUTCHCorrosion: $ 75
0:00 |Daily Total: $ 15,707
0:00
BHA
BIT 1 1.00
DLCACnNIrED MM SLICK 0.16 32.93
EVLTVEY 6.5 Monel 1 10.08
MA¥—G‘S—2'998 6.5 SDC 20 621.15
HWDP. 3 92.18
I AR P ek A DRLG JARS 31.70
DIV-OF Ol GAS & MINING WDP 18 55185
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 [ Sunnyside 10981° 0
Wasatch 3681° [} Kenilworth 11261° 0
[Mesaverde 7831° 0 Aberdeen 11461 0
Lower Measverc 9611° 0 Spring canyon 7?7 0
Castlegate 10442 0 Mancos 11536 0 TOTAL BHA = 1340.89
Desert 10661° 0 Dakota 16141° 2585 Survey
24.00 IGrassy 10841° O L) 16440 2864 Survey
P/U 330K FLARE DRLG: Degasser BKG GAS 0
S/I0 210K FLARE TRIP: NO Gas Buster CONN GAS 0
IROT. 270K LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET@ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 0 395
IEL Used: 300 On Hand: 10950 Co.Man__ Scott Allred TRIP GAS 0 395
BIT # 17 1 ICS 0OCS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP

[ conbiTion
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AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
RKB 25'
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth  16500' | Prog.Depth 16500’ DATE 5/7/08 | DAYS: 46
Current: Operations: DOWN TIME; W/O PARTS
Depth: 13556 IProgress 0 IDrIg Hrs: 0 IAV ROP: #DiV/0! IFormation: MANCOS
DMC: $1,200 TMC: $250,559 TDC: $11,466 JCWC: $3,090,997
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
IMw: 11.1 J#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit # 17 Cond: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 47  |sPm: 45 lSize: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 17/14 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FM36552Z int. Csg: $ Day Work $ -
Gel: 9/24/31 |sPm: 45 IMFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ Rental Tools: $ 3,960
WL: 17 |opm: 314 SIN: 10862476 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $ -
Cake: 3 Press: 1300 Jets: 7-16'S Well Head: $ Water: $ 4,066
Isolids: 16.2 _JavDec: 389 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ Fuel: $ -
IMBT 10 |avope: 104 Depth In: 13556 Packers: $ Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.0 |Jetver: 102 FTG: 0 Tanks: $ Logging: $ -
PHIM: .1/5.00 Jeco: 11.14 Hrs: 0 ISeparator: $ Cement: $ -
Chior: 4200 |sPR#1: FPH: #DIV/0! Heater: $ Bits: $ -
Ca : 40  |sPr#2: WOB: Pumping L/T: $ Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 6.6 |Btm.up: 79.6 R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ Camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T.  |M-RPM: $ Consultant: $ 1,350
START END TIME 423.5 | Total Rot. Hrs: . $ Drilling Mud: $ 1,200
6:00 18:00 12:00 DOWN TIME; TOOH LAY DOWN 6 DC's, CUT AND SLIP DRLG LINE Misc. / Labor: $ -
18:00 6:00 12:00 DOWN TIME; TIH LAY DOWN 33 JOINTS 20# D/P, TIH TO SHOE W/O CLUTCH Csg. Crew: $ -
6:00 Corrosion: $ 75
0:00 $ -
0:00 $ -
$ -
|Daily Total: $ 11,466
BHA
BIT 1 1.00
RECEIVED MMsiick | 0.16 32.93
- 6.5 Monel 1 10.08
MAY (7 2008 essoc | 14
HWDP 3 92.18
SREGE CH-GASSIING g 2L
HWDP 18 551.85
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981 0
Wasatch 3681 0 Kenilworth 11261 0
[Mesaverde 7831" 0 Aberdeen 11461 0
Lower Measverc 9611° 0 Spring canyon ?2?? [
Castlegate 10442° 0O Mancos 11536 0 TOTAL BHA = 719.74
Desert 10661" 0 Dakota 16141 2585 Survey
24.00 |Grassy 10841 0 L) 16440°  2884" Survey
IPIU 330K FLARE DRLG: Deg BKG GAS 0
S/O 210K FLARE TRIP: NO Gas Buster CONN GAS 0
IROT. 270K LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 0 395
EL Used: 300 On Hand: 10950 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS 0 395
BIT# 17 | ICS 0OCS DC LOC B/S G oDC RP

[ CONDITION
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AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
RKB 25'
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500’ | Prog.Depth 16500’ DATE 5/8/08 DAYS: 47
Current: Operations: DOWN T|ME; REPLACE DRUM CLUTCH ON DRAWORKS
Depth: 13556’ lProgress 0 IDrIg Hrs: 0 IAV ROP: #DIV/0O! IFormation: MANCOS
DMC: $1,200 TMC: $254,869 TDC: $7.,840 CWC: $3,101,146
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
|Mw: 11.2  J#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Bit #: 17 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 52  |spm: 45 Size: 778 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 16/16 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FM365572Z Int, Csg: $ - Day Work $ -
Gel: 9/23/33 |sPm: 45 IMFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 3,960
WL 16.8 JePMm: 314 S/N: 10862476 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2  {press: 1300 Jets: 7-16'S Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 16.2 Javoc: 389 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ -
MBT 10 Javop: 104 Depth In: 13556 Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 7.8 uetvel: 102 FTG: 0 Tanks: $ - |togging: $ -
PiIMf: .1/5.00 Jeco: 11.14 Hrs: 0 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 4200 |JsPR# : FPH: #D1V/0! Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
Ca : 20  JsPr#2: WOB: Pumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 6.2 |Btm.up: 79.6 R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ 440
Time Break Down: Total D.T.  |M-RPM: |Misc: cMT $ - |Consuttant: $ 1350
START END TIME 4475 l Total Rot. Hrs: 535.0 IDain Total: $ - |Dritling Mud: $ 1,200
6:00 0:00 18:00  JWAIT ON CLUTCH PARTS FOR DRAWORKS ( DOWN TIME ) Misc. / Labor: $ -
0:00 6:00 6:00 RPLACE DRUM CLUTCH ON DRAWORKS ( DOWNTIME ) Csg. Crew: $ -
Corrosion: $ 75
$ -
$ -
$ -
Daily Total: $ 7,840
BHA
BIT 1 1.00
ECENED MM sLicK 0.16 32.93
ki 6.5 Monel 1 10.08
MAY 08 2gf_]8 6.5 SDC 14 478.99
HWDP 3 92.18
BIV-OF OI-GAS S MINING AL
) ! HWDP 18 551.85
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981" o
Wasatch 3681" 0 Kenilworth 11261° 0
[Mesaverde 7831" o Aberdeen 11461° 0
Lower Measverc 9611° o Spring canyon ?22? 0
Castlegate 10442 0 Mancos 11536' 0 TOTAL BHA = 1198.73
Desert 10661° 0" Dakota 16141" 2585 Survey
24.00 |Grassy 10841° 0 ™ 16440° 2884 Survey
|PIU 330K FLARE DRLG: Deg BKG GAS 0
S/0 210K FLARE TRIP: NO Gas Buster CONN GAS 0
ROT. 270K LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET @ 4999’ KB PEAK GAS 0
FUEL Used: 450 On Hand: 7500 Co.Man Floyd Mitchell TRIP GAS 0
BIT # 17 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G oDC RP

[ CONDITION
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AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
RKB 25'
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth  16500" | Prog.Depth 16500' | DATE 5/9/08 DAYS: 48
Current: Operations: DOWNTIME:CHANGE OUT BLOCKS
Depth: 13556’ IProgress 0 IDrlg Hrs: 0 IAV ROP: #DIV/0! lFormation: MANCOS
DMC: $1,200 |TMC: $256,069 TDC: $7,400 CWC: $3,108,546
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Jvw: 11.3 |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit #: 17 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 48  |spm: Size: 7718 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PV/YP: 15/17 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FM3655ZZ Int. Csg: $ - Day Work $ -
Gel: 9/24/33 |sPm: IMFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - |Rentat Tools: $ 3,960
WL: 18  JcpPm: S/N: 10862476 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: Jets: 7-16'S Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solid 16.4 Javpc: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ -
MBT 10 |avor: Depth In: 13556 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 7.8 |uetvel: FTG: 0 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
Pf/ME: .1/5.2 Jeco: Hrs: 0 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 4200 |sPr#1: FPH: #DIV/O! Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
Ca : 20  |sPR#2: WOB: Pumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 5.4  |stm.up: 79.6 R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T.  |M-RPM: |Misc: cmT $ - |consuitant: $ 1,350
START | END TIME 471.5 I Total Rot. Hrs: 535.0- - IDaily Total: $ - |Driting Mud: $ 1,200
6:00 22:00 16:00 CONT. TO CHANGE OUT DRUM CLUTCH, REBUILD GAURDS TO FIT Misc. / Labor: $ -
22:00 6:00 8:00 R/U CRANE CHANGE OUT BLOCKS ( STRING UP ON 12 LINES ) Csg. Crew: $ -
(24 HOURS DOWNTIME ) Corrosion: $ 75
$ -
$ -
$ -
Daily Total: $ 7,400
BHA
BIT 1 1.00
MM SLICK 0.16 32.93
BECEIVED 6.5 Monel 1 10.08
e 65 SDC 14 478.99
MAY 19 72008 HWDP 3 92.18
o DRLG JARS 1 31.70
DIV-OF-OlL-GAS & HiNING N R
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981’ 0
Wasatch 3681" [ Kenilworth 11261° 0
|Mesaverde 7831° 0 Aberdeen 11461 o
Lower Measverc 9611° o Spring canyon 7?7 0
Castlegate 10442 0 Mancos 11538 0 TOTAL BHA = 1198.73
Desert 10661° 0 Dakota 16141° 2585" Survey
24.00 |Grassy 10841° ¢ ™ 16440°  2884° Survey
PIU 330K FLARE DRLG: Deg BKG GAS 0
S/I0 210K FLARE TRIP: NO Gas Buster CONN GAS 0
ROT. 270K LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET@ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 0
FUEL Used: 450 On Hand: 7500 Co.Man Floyd Mitchell TRIP GAS 0
BIT # 17 ] ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

[ conbDiTION
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AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
RKB 25’
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth _16500' | Prog.Depth  16500° DATE 5/12/08 DAYS: 51
Current: Operations: NIPPLE DOWN BOPE TO REPAIR SURF. CSG
|Depth: 13556 IProgress 0 IDrIg Hrs: 0 IAV ROP: #D1V/0! IFormation: MANCOS
[omc: $1,200 T™C: $277,259 TDC: $26,900 |cwc: $3,180,248
Contractor: Nabor 169 lMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 11.2  |#1_NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit # 17 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 48  |spm: 90 Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 17/16_|#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FM3655Z2Z Int. Csg: $ - Day Work $ 19,500
Gel: 10/21/32]sPm: IMFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 3,960
wi: 16.8 JoPm: 313 S/N: 10862476 Float Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 1750 Jets: 7-16'S Well Head: 3 - Water: $ -
Solid: 16.6 _JavDc: 7D Out: TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel: $ -
|mer 7.5 |avoe: Depth In: 13556 Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 83 |Jetver F1G: 0 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
PHMF: .5/6.1 Jecp: Hrs: 0 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chior: 4000 |sPR#1: FPH: #DIV/Q! Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 20 SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 6.5 |Btm.up: 79.6 R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: JMisc: CMT $ - Consultant: $ 1,350
START | END TIME 495.5 [ Total Rot. Hrs: 535.0 IDain Total: $ - |Dritling Mud: $ 1,200
6:00 9:00 3:00 LAY DOWN MM, MONEL SHORT DC, AND 3- 6" DCS Misc. / Labor: $ -
9:.00 10:00 1:00 TRIP IN HOLE W/25 STDS DP Csg. Crew: $ -
10:00 11:30 1:50 M/U HALIBURTON PACKER ON DP, TIH W/PACKER TO 120' AND SET Corrosion: $ 75
11:30 13:00 1:50 R/D "V" DOOR CLEAN OUT FRONT END FOR NIPPLE DOWN $ -
13:00 19:30 6:50 NIPPLE DOWN ROTATING HEAD & BOPE,STAND BOPE BACK IN SUB $ -
19:30 21:30 2:00 WAIT ON WELLHEAD INC TO GET WELLHEAD EQUIP. FROM MACHINE SHOP $ -
21:30 6:00 8:50 SET STACK ON WELLHEAD AND NIPPLE DOWN BOPE SEC X SEC W/RIG CREWS [Daily Total: $ 26,900
TO REPAIR SURF. CASING WHILE WAITING FOR NIPPLE DOWN CREW
{ WITH STACK IN 1 SEC. IT WAS DECIDED BY CO. MAN, & PUSHER TO BE UNSAFE
TO WORK ON WELLHEAD WITH STACK LEANING TOWARDS WELLHEAD )
BHA
BIT 1 1.00
|MM SLICK 0.16 32.93
6.5 Monel 1 10.08
NOTE:JOHN SCHLOTTMAN DERRICKHAND ON DAYLIGHT CREW WAS HURT WHILE}6.5 SDC 14 478.99
WORKING ON MUD PUMPS THIS WAS NOT A LOST TIME ACCIDENT,ACCIDENT HWDP 3 92.18
[ Y malay ml b ,EERQRT TO FOLLOW DRLG JARS 1 31.70
n CiIviEy) HWDP 18 551.85
MAY-+7-2008
L IV' Ul. "'-3 GAS & INlNG Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981° 0
Wasatch 3681 0 Kenilworth 11261 0
Mesaverde 7831° o Aberdeen 11461° 0
Lower Measverc 9611° [+ Spring canyon ?2?7? 0
Castlegate 10442 O’ Mancos 11536 0 TOTAL BHA = 1198.73
Desert 10661° 0 Dakota 16141° 2585 Survey
1.06 |Grassy 10841° 0O TO 16440°  2884° Survey
P/U FLARE DRLG: N/A Deg BKG GAS N/A
S/0 FLARE TRIP: Gas Buster CONN GAS N/A
iROT. LAST CSG.RA 95/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 1655
&L Used: 600 On Hand: 5100 Co.Man Floyd Mitchell TRIP GAS 1655
BIT# 17 | ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP

[ CONDITION




TS RISE s/

Y3-013- 33bis

GASC() GASCO ENERGY G ore Ny S
E—r—i-é?_ DAILY DRILLING REPORT TIGHT HOLE
gy RKB 25' AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth  16500' | Prog.Depth  16500' I DATE 5/13/08 DAYS: 52
Current: Operations: NIPPLE UP BOPE
|Depth:  13556' |Progress 0 |orig Hrs: 0 |av roP: #DIV/O! _|Formation: MANCOS
|pmc: $1,200 [mc: $279,650 TDC: $30,506  |owe: $3,210,754
IContractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
|r_aw: 1.2 |g1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Ian #: 17 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 48  |spm: 90 Isize: 77/8 |surt. csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 18/17 I_sz NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FM36552Z int. Csg: $ - ___|pay work $§ 19,500
Gel: 10/22/33)spm: JMFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
e 16.6_|opu: 313 |sm: 10862476 FloatEqup: ___$ - Irrucking: $ -
Cake: 2 |press: 1750 Iﬁs: 7-16'S |well Head: $ - |water: $ -
|sollds: 16.6 Javoc: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ = |Fuet $ -
Iya'r 7.5 Javop: Depth In:_ 13556 Packers: $ =~ |Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.3 |uetvet: FTG: o Tanks: $ - {Logging: $ -
PH/ME: 0.5 |eco: Hrs: 0 Separator: $ - e $ -
Chior: 4000 ISPR #1: FPH: #DIV/0! Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Cca : 20 |spre2: jwos: PumplngLIT: _ § - |oud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 6.5 lBtm.Up: 79.6 IR-RPM: IPrlme Mover: $ - |camp $ 560
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: lMIsc: cMT $ - |consultant: $ 1,350
START | END TIME 495.5 | Total Rot. Hrs: 535.0 ]Dauy Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 1,200
6:00 12:30 6:50 CONT T/NIPPLE DOWN BOPE AND SET OUT OF SUB ON MATTING BOARDS Misc. / Labor: $ 1,053
12:30 18:00 5:50 CUT OFF AND REPLACE DAMAGED SURF. CASING, WELD ON NEW WELLHEAD Csg. Crew: $ -
18:00 6:00 12:00 |RESTACK BOPE & NIPPLE UP Corrosion: $ 75
welding: $ 1903
$ -
$ -
oy P Y |Dally Total: $ 30,506
NGl Vi)
MAY--3-2008
BHA
DIV OF OIL GAS & MINING lorr 1 1.00
wmsuck | 016 32.93
[6.5 Monel 1 10.08
|NOTE:JOHN SCHLOTTMAN DERRICKHAND ON DAYLIGHT CREWS ACCIDENT HAS I6.5 SDC 14 478.99]
IBEEN RECLASSIFIED AS A LOST TIME ACCIDENT HWDP 3 92.1 8|
DRLG JARS 31.70
HWDP 18 551.85]
Dopth Fest To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981' 0
Wasatch 3681° 0 Kenliworth 11261° @
Mesaverde 7831° [} Aberdean 11461° 0
Lower Measverc __ 9811" 0 Spring canyon " [}
Castlegate 104420 © Mancos 11536' 0 TOTAL BHA = 1198.73
|Desert 10661° O Dakota 16141° 2685 Survey
24.00 |Grassy 10841° 0O 0 16440°  2884' Survey
PIU FLARE DRLG: N/A Degasser BKG GAS N/A
tSIO FLARE TRIP: Gas Buster CONN GAS N/A
ROT. LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET@ 4999' KB PEAK GAS N/A
FUEL Used: 450 On Hand: 4850 Co_._1Man Floyd Mitchell TRIP GAS N/A
BIT# 17 | ICS 0CS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP
| CONDITION




IS RISE S/b

) Y3013~ 23685
GASC” GASCO ENERGY GATE CYN gf
E————-—“— DAILY DRILLING REPORT TIGHT HOLE

nergy RKB 25 AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, ~110.240842
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500' | Prog.Depth 16500" DATE 5/14/08 | DAYS: 53
|Current: Operations: STAGE IN HOLE WIBIT #17
|Depth:  13556' |Progress 0 |prig Hrs: 0 jav roP: #DIV/O! ||=ormauon: MANCOS
lomc: $1,200 [rmc: $280,859 TDC: $92,794 |[cwc: $3,303,548
|Comractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Mw: 11.2 |g1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBIt #: 17 Conductor: $ - |tocCost: $ -
vIS: 49 |sPm: Isize: 77/8 |surt. csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
[pvive: 18/18 |_sg NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FM38552Z Iﬂmﬂg_ $ - |pay work $ 19,500
Gel: 9/20/31 |spPm: JMFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Teols: $ 3,960
e 16.8 Jopm: S/N: 10862476 Float Equp: $ - __ |Trucking $ -
Cake: 2 Jpress: Jets: 7-16'S Jwell Hoad: $ - jwater $ 1995
Solids: 16.6 _Javpc: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuer: $§ 30,156
ET 7.5 |avoe: Depth In: 13556 Packers: $ - {Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.3 |Jetvel: FTG: 0 [Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
PAME: .5/6.2 I-EcD: Hrs: 0 |separator: $ - |Cement: $ 5075
Chior: 4000 _|spri: FPH: #DIV/0! Heater: $ - |otts: $ -
Ca : 20 |sere: Jwos: PumpingLIT: __ § - IMud Motors: $ -
Dappppb: | 6.5 IBtm.Up: IR-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - |camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: Misc: CMT $ - |consuitant: $ 1,350
START | END TIME 4955 | Total Rot. Hrs: 535.0 |paiyToar  $ - |oriting Mua: $ 1,200
6:00 14:00 8:00 CONT. TO NIPPLE UP BOPE, R/U "V" DOOR & CATWALK Misc. / Labor: $§ 9720
14:00 16:00 2:00 PRESS. TEST PIPE AND BLND RAMS & CHOKE & KILL LINE VALVES TO 10,000 PSI__[Csg. Crew: $ -
I-TEST ANNULAR TO 2500 PSI, TEST 9 5/8" CASING TO 1500 PSI, ALL TESTS ( OK) Corrosion: $ 75
16:00 18:00 2:00 IHOLD PRE JOB SAFTEY MEETING R/U CEMENTERS TOP OFF 9 5/8" SURF. JWelding: $ -
CASING AND FILL CELLAR W/CEMENT FOR BOPE STABILITY, W/CLASS "G" Welhead: $ 8,503
JCEMENT MIXED @ 15.8 PPG AND 1.15 CUFT/SK YIELD, RIG DOWN CEMENTERS Packer: $ 10,445
18:00 | 23:00 5:00 TRIP IN HOLE W/PACKER RETRIEVAL TOOL ENGAGE PACKER, 750 PSI ON DP |Daily Total: $ 92,794
JCLOSE ANNULAR, BLEED OFF DP PRESSURE,P/U UNSET PACKER, NO FLOW
OPEN UP ANNULAR TRIP OUT OF HOLE W/PACKER AND LAY DOWN
23:00 0:00 1:00 MIX & PUMP 12.8 PPG SLUG
0:00 1:30 1:30 TRIP OUT OF HOLE WITH 25 STDS { PACKER TAIL ) BHA
1:30 3:00 1:30  JINSTALL WEAR BUSHING IN WELLHEAD BIT 1 1.00
3:00 6:00 3:00 |MIU BIT #17,P/U BHA STAGE IN HOLE JMM SLICK 0.16 32.93
. {6.5 Monel 1 10.08
nLvLIiviEy les soc 14 478.99
MA*_l_.q_zﬂ_&B HWDP 3 92,18
DRLG JARS 1 31.70
HWDP 18 551.85
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING
Depth  FeetToGo Depth Fest To Go
Green Rivar 25 [} Sunnyside 10981° [}
Wasatch 3681 0 Kenliworth 1261 @
|Mesaverde 7831 O Aberdeen 1461 ©
Lower Measverc 9611' 1} Spring canyon ?2%? 0
Castiegate 10442 O Mancos 11536 0 TOTAL BHA = 1198.73]
JDesert 10661" 0" Dakota 16141 2585' |Survey
24.00 |lGrassy 10841' O T 16440'  2884' Isurvey
P/U FLARE DRLG: N/A Degasser BKG GAS N/A
ISIO FLARE TRIP: Gas Buster CONN GAS N/A
ROT. LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET@ 4999' KB PEAK GAS N/A
FUEL Used: 450 On Hand: 11100 Co.Man Floyd Mitchell TRIP GAS N/A
BIT # 17 | ICS 0CS DC LOC BIS G ODC RP
CONDITION




TS RISE S/
Y3-013~-3368S

G ASC GASCO ENERGY G ATE CYNVN ST
Enerov DAILY DRILLING REPORT TIGHT HOLE
gy RKB 25 AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth  16500° | Prog.Depth 16500’ DATE 5/15/08 I DAYS: 54
Current: Operations: DRLG 77/8" HOLE
Ipepth:  13690" |Progress 134 |prig Hrs: 4 |av rOP: 335  |Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $4,300 TMC: $285,159 TDC: $30,440 |CWC: $3,333,988
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
[mw: 11.1  |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit # 17 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 50 |spm: 60 Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - |Rrig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 17/18 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FM3655Z2Z int. Csg: $ - Day Work $ 19,500
Gel: 9/22/26 {sPm: 60 IMFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
WL 16.8 JePMm: 413 SIN: 10862476 Float Equp: $ - ITrucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 3100 Jets: 7-16'S Well Head: $ - water: $ -
Isolids: 16.3 Javbc: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuer $ -
MBT 7.5 _JavDe: Depth In: 13556 Packers: $ - [MudLogger: $ 815
PH : 8.2 |Jetvel: FTG: 134 Tanks: $ - ___|Logging: $ -
PHME: .3/6 |ecp: Hrs: 4 |Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 4000 |sPr#1: FPH: 33.5 Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
Ca : 20 isPR#2: WOB: 20/25 Pumping LIT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 440
Dapp ppb: 6.4 |Btm.Up: R-RPM: 50/60 Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 64 fmisc: CMT $ - |consultant: $ 1,350
START | END TIME 495.5 I Total Rot. Hrs: 539.0 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 4,300
6:00 7:00 1:00 CONT. T/STAGE IN HOLE T/1500' FILL PIPE Misc. / Labor: $ -
7:00 12:00 5:.00 P/U 60 JNTS NEWLY HARDBANDED DP OFF PIPE RACKS Csg. Crew: $ -
12:00 14.00 2:00 CONT TRIP IN HOLE T/SHOE INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER Corrosion: $ 75
14:00 15:00 1:00 FILL PIPE CIRC OUT GAS & COND MUD Welding: $ -
15:00 15:30 0:50 CONT. TRIP IN HOLE TO 7000 $ -
15:30 | 16:30 1:00 FILL PIPE CIRC QUT GAS & COND MUD & HOLE $ -
16:30 17.00 0:50 CONT. TRIP IN HOLE TO 8000’ {Daily Total: $ 30,440
17:00 | 18:30 1:50 FILL PIPE CIRC OUT GAS & COND MUD & HOLE
18:30 19:00 0:50 CONT. TRIP IN HOLE T/9500'
19:00 20:00 1:00 FILL PIPE CIRC OUT GAS & COND MUD & HOLE
20:00 21:00 1:00 CONT. TRIP IN HOLE T/11,500' BHA
21:00 23:00 2:00 FILL PIPE CIRC OUT GAS & COND MUD & HOLE BIT 1 1.00
23:00 0:00 1:00 CONT. TRIP IN HOLE T/13,440' jMM SLICK 0.16 32.93
0:00 2.00 2:00 FILL PIPE WASH & REAM F/13,440' T/13,556' ( CIRC. OUT GAS ) 6.5 Monel 1 10.08
2:00 6:00 4:00 DRLG 77/8" HOLE F/13,556' T/13,690' ( 134' @ 33.5 FPH) 6.5 SDC 14 478.99
D rIV/eem HWDP 3 92.18
NEULIVLL) DRLG JARS 1 31.70
' | A%F 1 !HG{}O HWDP 18 551.85
o [)
UIV. U UIL, GAS & MININfTHoL0GY:80% SHALE 20% SAND
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25" 0 Sunnyside 10981" [
Wasatch 3681° [} Kenilworth 11261° 0
Mesaverde 7831 o Aberdeen 11461’ 0
Lower Measverc 9611" 0 Spring canyon 222 0
Castlegate 10442 0 Mancos 11536 0 TOTAL BHA = 1198.73
Desert 10661° 0 Dakota 16141 2451 Survey 6.5° 13545'
24.00 |Grassy 10841° 0O L) 16440° 2750 Survey
IP/U 330 FLARE DRLG: 5 TO 8 Deg: BKG GAS 1500
S/0 210 FLARE TRIP: 20'TO 30° Gas Buster CONN GAS 2200
IROT. 270 LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 8677
IFUEL Used: 900 On Hand: 10200 Co.Man Floyd Mitchell TRIP GAS 8677
BIT # N 17 ] ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

| CONDITION




Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

TS RISE S$~/6

Y3—0l13- 33685
GATE CYa” ST
TIGHT HOLE

RKB 25 AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth  16500" I Prog.Depth 16500° DATE 5/16/08 I DAYS: 55
Current: Operations: DRLG 77/8" HOLE
[Depth:  14525' IProgress 835 |Dr|g Hrs: 23 1/2 IAV ROP: 35.5 IFormation: MANCOS
lome: $8.207 ITMC: $293,367 TDC: $38,984 |cwcC: $3,372,972
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
{Mw: 11.8 _ J#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit # 17 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 48  |sem: 110 Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 16/19 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FM36552Z Int, Csg: $ - Day Work $ 19,500
Gel: 13/22/28]spm: jMFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - [Rental Tools: $ 3,960
wL: 16.4 |JePm: 383 ISIN: 10862476 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 665
Cake: 2 Press: 3400 Jets: 7-16'S Well Head: $ - lwater: $ -
Isolids: 17  javoc: 475 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - [Fuek $ -
IMBT 8 AV DP: 127 Depth in: 13556 Packers: $ - |MudLogger: $ 815
PH : 8.4 Juetvel 125 FTG: 969’ Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
Pf/ME: .5/6.5 |ecob: 12.2 Hrs: 27 112 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 4000 |sPr#1: FPH: 35.2 Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 20 |JsPr#2: wos: 23/27 P LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,585
Dapp ppb: 6 lBtm.Up: 69 MIN R-RPM: 50/60 Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 62 fMisc: cmT $ - |consuitant: $ 1,350
START END TIME 495.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 562.5 lDaily Total: $ - |oritling Mud: $ 8,207
6:00 6:30 0:50 DRLG 77/8" HOLE F/13,690' T/13,732' (42' @ 84 FPH ) Misc. / Labor: $ 1,827
6:30 7:00 0:50 _ |SERVICE TOP DRIVE Csg. Crew: $ -
7:00 6:00 23:00 DRLG 77/8" HOLE F/13,732' T/14,525' (793' @ 34.5 FPH ) Corrosion: $ 75
Welding: $ -
$ -
$ -
Daily Total: $ 38,984
PN W U SA W] ced me Y
HELUEIVED BHA
MA‘I' .l 6 2668 BIT 1 1.00
MM SLICK 0.18 32.93
6.5 Monel 1 10.08
DlV. OF 0"—, GAS & M‘NING 6.5 SDC 14 478.99
HWDP 3 92.18
DRLG JARS 1 31.70
HWDP 18 551.85
JLITHOLOGY:60% SHALE 40% SAND
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981" 0
Wasatch 3681° 0 Kenilworth 11261° 0
|Mesaverde 7831" 0 Aberdeen 11461 [
Lower Measverc 9611" [0} Spring canyon ??? 0
Castlegate 10442° 0 Mancos 11536" 0 TOTAL BHA = 1198.73
Desert 10661° 0 Dakota 16141° 1616' Survey 6.5° 13545'
24.00 |Grassy 10841° 0 D 16440 1915' Survey 5.7° 14069'
| 1Y) 335 FLARE DRLG: 3'TO 5 Deg BKG GAS 300
S/I0 215 FLARE TRIP: N/A Gas Buster CONN GAS 210
IROT. 275 LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 2754
IFUEL Used: 1800 On Hand: 8400 Co.Man  Floyd Mitchell TRIP GAS N/A
BIT # 17 ] ICs 0OCS DC LOC B/S G 0ODC RP

[ CONDITION




GASC
Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

TNS RisE Sk
L/ 3~013— 23685

TIGHT HOLE

RKB 25 AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth  16500° | Prog.Depth 16500" DATE 5/19/08 DAYS: 58
Current: Operations: STAGE IN HOLE W/BIT #18
Depth: 15273’ IProgress 0 IDrIg Hrs: 0 IAV ROP: #DIV/0! lFormation: MANCOS
lomc: $1,200 |TMC: $309,478 TDC: $21,618 |CWC: $3,467,368
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Jmw: 12.3  |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBIt #: 17 18 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 51  lspm: 91 ISize: 778 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PV/IYP: 16/20 J#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FM3655ZZ | FMH3753ZR |int. Csg: $ - Day Work $ 14,218
Gel: 18/28/37|sPm: |MFG: SECURITY SEC Prod Csg: $ - [Rental Tools: $ 3,960
wi: 23  |opm: 317 IS/N: 10862476 | 11024025RW |Fioat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 3 Press: 220 Jets: 7-16'S 6 x 16 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 19.3 _Javoc: TD Out: 15273 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet $ -
IMBT 11 AV DP: Depth In: 13556 15,270 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.6 |Jetvel FTG: 1717' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
PfIMF: .6/6.0 |ecD: 12.5 Hrs: 51 1/2 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 4000 |sPrR#1: FPH: 33.3 Heater: $ - |sits:
Ca : 20  |sPr#2: WOB: 23/27 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 6 lBtm.Up: R-RPM: 50/60 Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 55 Misc: CMT $ - Consultant: $ 1,350
sTarT | END TIME 510 | Total Rot, Hrs: 586.5 |paiyTotar:  $ - |oriting Mug: $ 1200
6:00 8:00 2:00 WORK ON WATER BOX FOR DRAWORKS BRAKE COOLING SYSTEM(DOWNTIME)  {Misc. / Labor: $ -
8:00 9:30 1:50 TRIP IN HOLE W/BHA, W/ROTORY TABLE AND RIG TONGS ( KILL STRING ) Csg. Crew: $ -
9:30 14:.00 4:50 WAIT ON PARTS F/ST80 AND AIR SPINNERS TO TRIP IN HOLE ( DOWNTIME ) Corrosion: $ 75
14:00 21:00 7:00 P/U NEWLY HARDBANDED DP OFF PIPE RACKS & TRIP IN HOLE TO CSG SHOE Welding: $ -
21:00 22:00 1:00 INSTALL ROTATING HEAD FILL PIPE CIRC OUT GAS $ -
22:00 23:30 1:50 CONT TRIP IN HOLE T/6700' $ -
23:30 0:30 1:00 FILL PIPE CIRC OUT GAS COND. HOLE & MUD |Daily Total: $ 21,618
0:30 1:00 0:50 SERVICE TOP DRIVE
1:00 2:00 1:00 CONT.TRIP IN HOLE T/9000*
2:00 3:00 1:00 FILL PIPE CIRC OUT GAS COND. HOLE & MUD
3:00 4:00 1:00 CONT. TRIP IN HOLE T/11,120' BHA
04:00 5:30 1:50 FILL PIPE CIRC QUT GAS COND. HOLE & MUD BIT 1 1.00
5:30 6:00 0:50 CONT. TRIP IN HOLE ,CURRENTLY @ 11,868' JMM SLICK 0.16 32.93
6.5 Monel 1 10.08
RECEIVED 6.5 SDC 14 478.99
HWDP 3 92.18
MAY 1 g 20[]8 DRLG JARS 1 31.70
HWDP 18 551.85
el T 0 GAS & MINING
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981° 0
Wasatch 3681 O Kenilworth 11261 0
|Mesaverde 7831° 0 Aberdeen 11461" 0
Lower Measverc 9611" 0 Spring canyon 2?7? 0
Castlegate 10442 0O Mancos 11536 0 TOTAL BHA = 1198.73
Desert 10661 0° Dakota 16141" 868" Survey 5.6° 14574
24.00 [Grassy 10841 0 TD 16650° 1377 Survey 5.1° 14858'
IP/lU 335 FLARE DRLG: N/A Deg OFF BKG GAS N/A
SIO 215 FLARE TRIP: 15'TO 20' Gas Buster: ON CONN GAS N/A
IROT. 275 LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET @ 4999" KB PEAK GAS 1785
IEL Used: 1050 OnHand: 5550 Co.Man  Floyd Mitchell TRIP GAS 1785
BIT # _ 17 | ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G oDC RP
| CONDITION 2 3 BT B X | CT PR




GASC
Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

AFE # 40104

TUS Risre S
Y3013~ 353085

TIGAT HOLE

GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942

RKB 25'
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth  16500" | Prog.Depth 16500° DATE 5/20/08 | DAYS: 59
Current: Operations: DRLG 77/8" HOLE
Depth: 15443’ IProgress 170 IDrIg Hrs: 15 IAV ROP: 11.3 IFormation: MANCOS
DMC: $11,753 ITMC: $322,031 TDC: $40,398 |CWC: $3,507,766
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Jaw: 12.1 }#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 lBit #: 18 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 47  IsPm: 114 ISize: 77/8 {Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PV/YP: 14/20 J#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FMH3753ZR int. Csg: $ - Day Work $ 19,500
Gel: 17/24/28]spm: JMFG: SEC Prod Csg: $ ~  |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
WL 23  |cpm: 397 SIN: 11024025RW Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 3 Press: 2950 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Isotids: 18  |avoc: 493 D Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet $ -
- 10 |avoe: 132 Depth In: 16273 Packers: $ - [Mudvogger: $ 815
PH : 8.6 |etvel: 130 FTG: 170 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
PH/Mf: .8/6  Jecp: 12.5 Hrs: 15 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 3800 IsPrii: 620@30SPM _|FPH: 11.3 Heater: $ - |Bits:
Cca : 20 |spr#2: WOB: 17/27 Pumping LIT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 1650
Dapp ppb: 5.8 |stm.up: 71 MIN R-RPM: 50/60 Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 64 |Misc: cmT $ - |consutant: $ 1350
sTART | EnD TIME 510 Total Rot. Hrs: 6015 JoaiyTota:  $ - |pritling Mud: § 11,753
6:00 7.00 1:00 CONT. TRIP IN HOLE T/12,580' Misc. / Labor: $ 1,295
7:00 8:30 1:50 FILL PIPE, CIRC OUT GAS, COND HOLE & MUD Csg. Crew: $ -
8:30 9:30 1:00 CONT. TRIP IN HOLE T/14,100' Corrosion: $ 75
9:30 11:30 2:00 FILL PIPE, CIRC OUT GAS, COND HOLE & MUD Welding: $ -
11:30 12:30 1:00 CONT. TRIP IN HOLE T/15,173' $ -
12:30 13:00 0:50 FILL PIPE WASH & REAM F/15,173' T/15,273' ( NO FILL ) $ -
13:00 14:30 1:50 CIRC OUT GAS COND HOLE & MUD Daily Total: $ 40,398
14:30 21:00 6:50 DRLG 77/8" HOLE F/15,273' T/15,330' ( 57' @ 8.8 FPH )
21:00 21:30 0:50 SERVICE TOP DRIVE
21:30 6:00 8:50 IDRLG 77/8" HOLE F/15,330' T/15,443' (113' @ 13.3 FPH)
BHA
BIT 1 1.00
P —— |MM SLICK 0.16 32.93
RECEIVED 6.5 Monel 1 10.08
. 6.5 SDC 14 478.99
Mﬁ_ﬁ—zﬁﬂs HWDP 3 92.18
DRLG JARS 1 31.70
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING HWDP 18 551.85
LITHOLOGY:90% SHALE, 10% SAND
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981° 0
Wasatch 3681" 0 Kenilworth 11261 0
[Mesaverde 7831" 0 Aberdeen 11461 [
Lower Measverc 9611" 0 Spring canyon ?7? 0
Castlegate 10442 O Mancos 11536" 0 TOTAL BHA = 1198.73
Desert 10661" 0 Dakota 16141" 698" Survey 5.1° 14858'
24.00 [Grassy 10841° 0 ™ 16650° 1207 Survey 5.2° 15241"
|PiU 335 FLARE DRLG: 10'TO 25’ Deg . OFF BKG GAS 500
SIO 215 FLARE TRIP: 20'TO 35' Gas Buster: ON CONN GAS 1985
ROT. 275 LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 2090
[FUEL Used: 1550 On Hand: 10800 Co.Man Floyd Mitchell TRIP GAS 2200
BIT # 18 | ICS [e]e] DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

[ CONDITION




GASCO
Energy

AFE # 40104

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

TUS KIsSE s—4
%3 013~ 3368S"

HERT fic

OLE

GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942

RKB 25'
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth  16500' | Prog.Depth 16500' | DATE 5/21/08 I DAYS: 60
Current: Operations: DRLG 77/8" HOLE
[Depth: 15751' ]Progress 308 [Drlg Hrs: 23 IAV ROP: 13.4 IFormatlon: MANCOS
|ome: $6,425 [rme: $322,031 TDC: $51,139 |cwe: $3,558,905
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Jmw: 12.2 |g1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBIt #: 18 c $ - JtocCost: $ -
vis: 40  |sPm: 114 ISize: 77/8 Isurt. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 40/14 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FMH3753ZR Int. Csg: $ - |pay work $ 19,500
Gel: 10/18/23}spm: JMFG: SEC Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,90
WL: 19  [cPMm: 397 IS/N: 11024025RW Float Equp: $ - |1r g $ -
Cake: 3 Press: 3050 Jets: 6X16 well Head: $ - |water: $ 3,258
Isolids: 17 Javoc: 493 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet $ -
IMBT 10 {avop: 132 Depth In: 15273 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.5 Juetvek 130 FTG: 478" Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
PfIMF: .5/5.4 [ecp: 12.6 Hrs: 38 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 4000 |sPr#1: 620@30SPM _|FPH: 12.6 Heater: $ - |Bits:
Ca : 20 |sPr#2: WOB: 17/30 Pumping U/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,530
Dapp ppb: 5.5 |stm.up: 71 MIN R-RPM: 50/60 Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 64 misc: cMT $ - |consultant: $ 1,350
sTAarRT | END TIME 510 | Total Rot. Hrs: 624.5° " paily Tota: $ - |prilling Mud: $ 6,425
6:00 11:30 5:50 DRLG 77/8" HOLE F/15,443' T/15,470' (27' @ 5 FPH ) Misc. / Labor: $ 11,276
11:30 12:00 0:50 CHANGE ROTATING HEAD RUBBER Csg. Crew: $ -
12:00 16:30 4:50 DRLG 77/8" HOLE F/15,470' T/15,561' (91' @ 20.2 FPH ) Corrosion: $ 75
16:30 17:00 0:50 SERVICE TOP DRIVE & RIG Welding: $ -
17:00 6:00 13:00 DRLG 77/8" HOLE F/15,561' T/15,751' (190' @ 14.6 FPH ) Shaker Screens: $ 1,950
$ -
|Daily Total: $ 51,139
BHA
BIT 1 1.00
MM SLICK 0.16 32.93
RECE'VED 6.5 Monel 1 10.08
6.5 SDC 14 478.99
M_AY 2 ] 2008 HWDP 3 92.18
DRLG JARS 1 31.70
E QI ’ GAS & MINING HWDP 18 551.85
JLITHOLOGY:90% SHALE, 10% SAND
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25' 0 Sunnyside 10981° 0
Wi h 3681° [V Kenilworth 11261" [
|Mesaverde 7831° (3 Aberdeen 11461' 0
Lower Measverc 9611° 0 Spring canyon 7?7? 0
Castlegate 10442 0O Mancos 11536 0 TOTAL BHA = 1198.73
JDesert 10661° 0 Dakota 16141 390° Survey 5.1° 14858"
24.00 IGrassy 10841° O D 16650" 899’ Survey 5.2° 15241
1P/U 335 FLARE DRLG: NO Degasser: OFF BKG GAS 1400
SIO 215 FLARE TRIP: N/A Gas Buster: ON CONN GAS 2556
|ROT. 275 LAST CSG.RA 95/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 3260
llEll. Used: 1950 On Hand: 8850 Co.M_an Floyd Mitchell TRIP GAS N/A
BIT# 18 | ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

[T ConDITION




T NS RISE S
L/sf 03~ 336 5r5/*

G A SC{“; GASCO ENERGY P Cyr
W DAILY DRILLING REPORT TIGHT HOLE
gy RKE 25' AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500 | Prog.Depth 16500 DATE 5/22/08 l DAYS: 61
Current: Operations: TRIP IN HOLE
|Depth: 15784 IProgress 33 IDrIg Hrs: 5 IAV ROP: 6.6 IFormatlon: MANCOS
|ome: $1,200 [Tmc: $323,231 TDC: $39,023  |cwc: $3,597,928
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
IMw: 12.2  |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit # 18 19 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 44 |spm: 114 Size: 77/8 778 Surf. Csg: $ - |Rrig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 13/12 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FMH3753ZR | FM3655ZZ |int. csg: $ - |pay work $ 19,500
Gel: 8/11/14 |sPm: iMFG: SEC SEC Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
wL: 24  |ePm: 397 IS/N: 11024025RW Float Equp: $ - |7 g $ -
Cake: 3 Press: 3050 Jets: 6X16 well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Isolids: 18 JavDc: 493 7D Out: 15784 TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel: $ -
IMBT 11  |avoe: 132 Depth In: 15273 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.5 |etvel: 130 FTG: 511' Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
PIME: .5/5.4 |ecp: 12.6 Hrs: 38 {Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 4000 |spr#1: 620@30SPM [rpH: 12.6 Heater: $ - |Bits: $ 10,500
Ca : 20 ISPR #2: wosB: 17/30 P LT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 550
Dapp ppb: 55 IBtm.Up: 71 MIN  |rR-RPM: 50/60 Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ 1,073
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |m-RPM: 64 |Misc: cmT $ - |consultant: $ 1,350
START | END TIME 510 I Total Rot. Hrs: 629.5 IDaily Total: $ - [Drilling Mud: $ 1,200
6:00 11:00 5:00 DRLG 15751 TO 15773 (33 @ 6.6 FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ -
11:00 12:00 1:00 CIRC AND COND MUD ( MIX AND PUMP PILL) Csg. Crew: $ -
12:00 1:00 13:00 JTOOH Corrosion: $ 75
1:00 2:30 1:30 CHANGE OUT BIT AND MOTOR Welding: $ -
2:30 3:30 1:00 PULL AND CHECK WEAR BUSHING Shaker Screens: $ -
3:30 4:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE ( TOP DRIVE) $ -
4:00 6:00 2:00 TIH W/ BIT #19 |Daily Total: $ 39,023
BHA
BIT 1 1.00
ECEIV/ED MM SLICK 0.16 32.93
kit 65 SDC 14 478.99
MA' 2 i 2998 HWDP 3 92.18
DRLG JARS 31.70
NIV AR AL OAC D A N HWDP 18 551.85
DV-OF O GAS- & MINING
LITHOLOGY:90% SHALE, 10% SAND
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25" [ Sunnyside 10981" [
Wasatch 3681° [ Kenilworth 11261° o
JMesaverde 7831 0 Aberdeen 11461° 0
Lower Measverc 9611° 0 Spring canyon ?77? 0
Castlegate 10442 0 Mancos 11536' 0 TOTAL BHA = 1188.65
Desert 10661" 0 Dakota 16141" 357" Survey 5.1° 14858’
24.00 |Grassy 10841° 0 k12 16650 866’ Survey 5.2° 15241'
IPIU 335 FLARE DRLG: NO Deg. OFF BKG GAS 1000
SIO 215 FLARE TRIP: N/A Gas Buster: ON CONN GAS 1070
IROT. 275 LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET@ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 1070
FUEL Used: 1950 On Hand: 8850 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS N/A
BIT# 18 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G 0ODC RP
| CONDITION 1 1 CT S X ] BT PR




TUs BISE sk

GASC! ) GASCO ENERGY Y2 015~ B3I
e DAILY DRILLING REPORT TlGHT HOLE
Energy 03
AFE # 40104 Pt 38055138, 110 Jav042
RKB 25'
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 165(L Prog.Depth 16500° DATE 5/23/08 DAYS: 62
Current: Operations: DOWN TIME; CIRC ON HOLE @ 11041' WAIT ON WELDER
|Depth: 15783' IProgress 32 IDrIg Hrs: 0 IAV ROP: #DIV/0! IFormation: MANCOS
DMC: $1,614 ITMC: $324,845 TDC: $27,314 |cwc: $3,625,242
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 12.2 |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBIt #: 19 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 44  |sem: 114 Size: 778 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 15/18 [#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FM365527 Int. Csg: $ - |Day Work $ 19,500
Gel: 16/21/23]sPm: IMFG: SEC Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
WL 28  |cPM: 397 ]sm: 10827282 Float Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 3 Press: 3050 Jets: 6X16 well Head: $ - Iwater: $ -
Solids: 18 lavoc: 493 D Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ -
mBT 11 javoe: 132 Depth In: 15783 Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.5 Juetver 130 FTG: [0} Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
PIME: .5/5.4 [eco: 12.6 Hrs: 0 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 4000 fspr#1: 620@30SPM _JFpH: 12.6 Heater: $ - [eits: $ -
Ca : 20 |sPr#2: WOB: 17/30 Pumping L/T: $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 5.5 |Btm.up: 71 MIN  |rRRPM: 50/60 Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T.  |MRPM: 64 |Misc: CMT $ - |Consultant: $ 1,350
START END TIME 522 I Total Rot. Hrs: 629.5 IDaIIy Total: $ - |Driting Mud: $ 1614
6:00 15:00 9:00 STAGE IN HOLE EVERY 2,000' AND CIRC QUT GAS Misc. / Labor: $ -
15:00 16:00 1:00 WORK TIGHT HOLE SET OFF JARS, TOP DRIVE HIT BOARD BENDING IT DOWN. Csg. Crew: $ -
16:00 18:00 2:00 CIRC QUT GAS Corrosion: $ 75
18:00 6:00 12:00 DOWN TIME; CIRC ON HOLE @ 11041' WAIT ON WELDER MAKE NEW BOARD Welding: $ -
Shaker Screens: $ -
$ -
|Daily Total: $ 27,314
BHA
RECFIVFD BIT 1 1.00
MM SLICK 0.16 32.93
MAY 2 3 2008 6.5 SDC 14 478.99
HWDP 3 92.18
DIV OF Ol GAS & MINING oRicumrs |t 31.70
HWDP 18 551.85
JLITHOLOGY:90% SHALE, 10% SAND
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981° [
Wasatch 3681° 0 Kenilworth 11261° 0’
|Mesaverde 7831 0 Aberdeen 11461 [}
Lower Measverc 9611° 0 Spring canyon 7?? 0
Castlegate 10442 O Mancos 11536" 0 TOTAL BHA = 1188.65
JDesert 10661° 0 Dakota 16141" 358' Survey 5.1° 14858'
24.00 IGrassy 10841 O TD 16650° 867" Survey 5.2° 15241’
P/U 335 FLARE DRLG: 2' Degasser: OFF BKG GAS
S/O 215 FLARE TRIP: 10'TO 15' Gas Buster: ON CONN GAS
ROT. 275 LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 692
IﬂJ_E_L Used: 1950  On Hand: 8850 Co.Man _ Scott Allred TRIP GAS N/A
BIT# - 19 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP
| CONDITION




GASC.
Energy

GASCO ENERGY

T/1S RlsE S5-It

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Y3-013— 33695
GHre ey Er-

TIGHT HOLE

RKB 25' AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth  16500° | Prog.Depth 16500° DATE _ 5/27/08 DAYS: 66
Current: Operations: CUT DRLG LINE
Depth: 16130 [Progress 10 |orgHrs: 21/2 |avrop: 4.0  |rormation: MANCOS
DMC: $1,200 ITMC: $352,471 TDC: $28,325 |cwc: $3,768,672
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
|Mw: 12.5 |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 |Blt # 19 20 Conductor: $ - {Loc,Cost: $ -
viS: 62 |sem: 100 Size: 778 7718  |surt.csg: $ - |Rrig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 22/32 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FM36552Z MS1666D  |int. csg: $ - |paywork $ 19,500
Gel: 15/21/27|spm: JvFG: SEC ULTERRA  |prod csg: $ - [Rental Tools: $ 3,960
wL: 17 lePMm: 340 SIN: 10827282 5008 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 1,150
Cake: 2 Press: 3000 Jets: 6X16 6X14 \Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Isolids: 18 Javpc: 445 7D Out: 16130 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ -
{wer 10_[avoe: 119 [peptnn: 15783 16,130 _|packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.4  |Jetvel: 117 FTG: 347" Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
PHIMf: .4/5.3 [eco: 12.6 Hrs: 29 1/2 }separator: $ - |cement: $ -
Chlor: 4100 |JsPR#1: 620@30SPM _|FPH: 11.8 Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 20 ISPR #2: woB: 10/20 Pumping LIT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 275
Dapp ppb: 6.5 IBtm.Up min: 76 R-RPM: 50/60 Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |[M-RPM: 56 [Misc: cMT $ - Consultant: $ 1,350
START END TIME 556 I Total Rot. Hrs: 659.0 'Daily Total: $ - |prilling Mud: $ 1,275
6:00 8:30 2:30 DRLG 16120"' TO 16130' { 10° @ 4 FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ -
8:30 9:30 1:00 CIRC. HOLE MIX AND PUMP PILL Csg. Crew: $ -
9:30 22:00 12:30  {TOOH Welding: $ -
22:00 0:00 2:00 LAY DOWN MOTOR AND CHANGE OUT BIT P/U MONEL DC Shaker Screens: $ -
0:00 3:30 330 TIH TO 5000 $ -
3:30 6:00 2:30 INSTALL ROTATING RUBBER AND CUT AND SLIP DRLG LINE $ -
Daily Total: $ 28,325
BHA
RECEIVED BT 1 1.00
N BIT SUB 1 4.00
MATY Z / 2008 MONELDC | 1 30.75
) DC's 14 434.90
DIV. OF ol, GAS-&FMI-NLNG HWDP 3 92.18
DRLG JARS 1 31.70
HWDP 18 551.05
JLITHOLOGY:80% SHALE, 20% SAND
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25" 0 Sunnyside 10981' 0
\Wasatch 3681° 0 Kenilworth 11261° 0
Mesaverde 7831 0 Aberdeen 11461’ 0
Lower Measverc 9611° o Spring canyon ?? o
Castlegate 10442 0 Mancos 11536' 0 TOTAL BHA = 1145.58
Desert 10661° 0 Dakota 16141° 11’ Survey 5.1° 14858"
24.00 |Grassy 10841° 0 D 16675° 545 Survey 5.2° 15241
P/U 425 FLARE DRLG: 2’ TO 4 Degasser: ON BKG GAS 900
S/0 275 FLARE TRIP: NA Gas Buster: ON CONN GAS 710
|ROT. 325 LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET@ 4999" KB PEAK GAS 875
IFUEL Used: 900 On Hand: 8100 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS
BIT# _& ICS 0OCS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP
| CONDITION 1 2 WT SEC X i NO PR




TS RlsFE S~p
Y 3-01F~ 32635

G ASC! GASCO ENERGY CRrE Cyu S
E DAILY DRILLING REPORT TIGHT HOLE
nergy AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
RKB 25'
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500’ | Prog.Depth 16500’ | DATE 5/28/08 DAYS: 67
Current: Operations: WORK STUCK PIPE
|Depth: 16130 IProgress 10 IDrIg Hrs: 21/2 IAV ROP: 4.0 IFormauon: Dakota
DMC: $8,246 ITMC: $360,717 TDC: $46,788 |cwce: $3,815,460
Contractor: Nabor 169 ) IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
[Mw: 12.4 |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit #: 20 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 58 |sPm: 100 Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 17/38 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: MS1666D Int. Csg: $ - |pay work $ 19,500
Gel: 18/26/40)sPm: |mFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
wL: 18.2 |cpm: 340 SIN: 5008 Float Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ 8,307
Cake: 2 Press: 3000 Jets: 6X14 Wwell Head: $ - |water: $ -
Isolids: 18 lavoc: 445 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - {Fuel $ -
IMBT 10 lavDe: 119 Depth In: 16,130 JPackers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.4 |uetver: 117 FTG: 0 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
PfIMF: .4/5.3 |ecp: 12.6 Hrs: Separator: $ - |cement: $ -
o | 4100 |spr#1:  620@30SPM_|reh: #VALUE! Heater: $ - o $ ]
Ca: 20 ISPR #2: woB: 10/20 Pumping LIT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 6.5 IBtm,Up min: 76 R-RPM: 50/60 Prime Mover: $ - |camp $ 4535
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 56 |Mmisc: cmT $ - |consuitant: $ 1,350
START END TIME 556.5 [ Total Rot. Hrs: 661.5 |Dany Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 8,321
6:00 | 8:30 2:30 _ JCONT. CUTTING DRLG LINE Misc. / Labor: $ -
8:30 | 9:00 0:30__ |CIRC. OUT GAS @ SHOE Ccsg. Crew: $ -
9:00 9:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE Welding: $ -
9:30 14:00 4:30 TIH Shaker Screens: $ -
14:00 16:00 2:00 CIRC. OUT GAS @ 11,000 $ -
16:00 19:30 3:30 TIH TAG TIGHT SPOT @ 11050 WORK STUCK PIPE $ -
19:30 20:00 0:30 DOWN TIME;WORK ON SCR ELECTRICAL PROBLEMS |Daily Total: $ 46,788
20:00 20:30 0:30 TIH HOLE TWO STD WORK STUCK PIPE
20:30 0:00 3:30 WORK STUCK PIPE, SPOT 25 BBLS DIESEL AND DRILL ZONE WORK PIPE
0:00 6:00 6:00 WORK PIPE AND MOVE DIESEL 2BBLS EVERY HR.
BHA
BIT 1 1.00
BIT SUB 1 4.00
R_EGEDIEI"‘ y MONEL DG 1 30.75
st bC's 14 434.90
MAY—Z-B—'ZDQS HWDP 3 92.18
- DRLG JARS 1 31.70
D}‘V’. OF O:L, GAS 0 ”IMING HWDP 18 551.05
LITHOLOGY:80% SHALE, 20% SAND
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981" [
Wasatch 3681" 0 Kenilworth 11261' 0
JMesaverde 7831° 0 Aberdeen 11461 0
Lower Measverc 9611° 0 Spring canyon ?2?7? 0
Castlegate 104427 0O Mancos 11536' 0 TOTAL BHA = 1145.58
Desert 10661 0 Dakota 16141° 11’ Survey 5.1° 14858’
24.00 |Grassy 10841° 0 TD 16675° 545’ Survey 5.20 15241
IP/U 425 FLARE DRLG: 2°’ TO 4' Deg . _ON BKG GAS 900
S/0 275 FLARE TRIP: NA Gas Buster: ON CONN GAS 710
IROT. 325 LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET@ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 875
I_IEE Used: 900 On Hand: 8100 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS
BIT# 20 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

[ CONDITION




GASC
Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

TUS RIsFE STU
Y3-013—~2 A68S5~

Gpre CYv Sy~

TIGHT HOLE

RKB 25 AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth  16500" | Prog.Depth 16500' DATE 5/29/08 DAYS: 68
Current: Operations: WASH AND REAM THRU TIGHT HOLE
Depth: 16130' [Progress 10 |prig Hrs: 21/2  |avRor: 4.0  |rormation: Mancos
[omc: $18,782 {Tmc: $379,499 TDC: $63,682 [cwc: $3,879,142
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 12.4 |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit # 20 21 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 58 |sPm: 100 Size: 77/8 77/8  |surt.Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
pVIYP: 17/38 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: MS1666D | FMH37537ZR fint. csg: $ - |pay work $ 19,500
Gel: 18/26/40]spm: MFG: ULTERRA SEC Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
WiL: 18.2 JePm: 340 SIN: 5008 11165678 |Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 3000 Jets: 6X14 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
|solids: 18 |avoc: 445 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ -
IMBT 10 |AavDp: 119 Depth In: 16,130 16,130 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.4  Petvel: 117 FTG: 0' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ 8700
PIMF: .4/5.3 Jeco: 12.6 Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 4100 ISPR #1: 620@30SPM _[FPH: #VALUE! Heater: $ - Bits: $ 10,500
Ca : 20  |sPR#2: WOB: 10/20 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 5.1 |Btm.Up min: 76 R-RPM: 50/60 Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ -
Time Break Down: TotalD.T. [M-RPM: 56 |Misc: cmT $ - |Consultant: $ 1,350
START END TIME 556.5 l Total Rot. Hrs: 664.0 lDain Total: $ - |oritting Mud: $ 18,857
6:00 6:30 0:30 CONT. TO WORK STUCK PIPE Misc. / Labor: $ -
6:30 8.00 1:30 PIPE CAME FREE MIX PILL Csg. Crew: $ -
8:00 15:00 7:00 |TOOH TO CHECK BIT Welding: $ -
15:00 19:00 4:00 CHAND OUT BIT AND TIH TO 5,000' CIRC. OUT GAS Shaker Screens: $ -
19:00 22:00 3:00 TIH TO 10730 $ -
22:00 6:00 8:00 CIRC OUT GAS AND REAM TO 11170 $ -
Daily Total: $ 63,682
BHA
RECEIVED BIT 1 1,00
- BIT SUB 1 4.00
MAY_Lg_zggg MONELDC | 1 30.75
i ~ bCs 14 434.90
| OE-O”:;-GAS-&-MMNG HWDP 3 92.18
T DRLG JARS 1 31.70
HWDP 18 551.05
LITHOLOGY:80% SHALE, 20% SAND
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981° [
Wasatch 3681° 0 Kenilworth 11261° 0
|Mesaverde 7831 o Aberdeen 11461° 0
Lower Measverc 9611° 0 Spring canyon ?2?? 0
Castlegate 10442 0 Mancos 11536' 0 TOTAL BHA = 1145.58
Desert 10661 0 Dakota 16141° 11 Survey 5.1° 14858'
24.00 |Grassy 10841° 0 D 16675' 545' Survey 5.2° 15241'
P/U 425 FLARE DRLG: 2 TO 4' Deg : _ON BKG GAS 900
SI0 275 FLARE TRIP: NA Gas Buster: ON CONN GAS 710
|IROT. 325 LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 8220
Iﬂ Used: 900 On Hand: 8100 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS
BIT # 20 ICS 0OCS DC LOC B/S G 0DC RP
| CONDITION 1 6 BT G X 1/8 NO CB




GASC.
Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

TS RISE S
L/3_013~ 3685
prE. CM 87

TIGHT HOLE

AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
RKB 25'
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500’ | Prog.Depth _ 16500' DATE 5/30/08 DAYS: 69
Current: Operations: WASH AND REAM TO 12045’
Depth: 16130' IProgress 0 IDrIg Hrs: 21/2 IAV ROP: 0.0 lFormatlon: Mancos
DMC: $8,979 ITMC: $388,478 TDC: $53,526 |cwc: $3,932,668
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
|mw: 12.2  [#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBIt # 21 c $ - |roc,Cost: $ -
vis: 57  |spm: 100 Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 23/21 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FMH3753ZR int. Csg: $ - |Day work $ 19,500
Gel: 15/22/34]spm: MFG: SEC Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
WL: 13.6 Jcpm: 360 IS/N: 11165678 Float Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 3000 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - |water: $ 8347
ISolids: 18 Javoc: 441 7D Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet $ -
MBT 125 |avop: 118 Depth In: 16,130 Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 815
PH : 8.5  Juetvel 116 FTG: 0 Tanks: 3 - Logging: $ -
PfiME: .4/5.3 |eco: 12.5 Hrs: |Separator: 3 - |cement: $ -
Chlor: 4100 |spr#1: 620@30SPM _|FPH: #VALUE! Heater: $ - |Bits: $ 10,500
Ca : 20 |sPr#2: WOB: 10/20 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 5.9  |Btm.Up min: 76 R-RPM: 50/60 Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [M-RPM: 56 |misc: cMT $ - |consultant: $ 1,350
START END TIME 556.5 I Total Rot. Hrs: 666.5 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 9,054
6:00 18:00 12:.00 {WASH AND REAM 11170" TO 11780 610' Misc. / Labor: $ -
18:00 6:00 12:00 _ ]JWASH AND REAM 11170' TO 12045 265 Csg. Crew: $ -
6:00 Welding: $ -
0:00 Shaker Screens: $ -
0:00 $ -
0:00 $ -
Daily Total: $ 53,526
REC EIVED BHA
il BIT 1 1.00
MALB.[LZGQ& BIT SUB 1 4.00
MONEL DC 1 30.75
DIV-OF OIL-GAS-& DC's 14 434.90
hbinhadde MmmG HWDP 3 92.18
DRLG JARS 31.70
HWDP 18 551.05
LITHOLOGY:80% SHALE, 20% SAND
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981° 0
Wasatch 3681" 0" Kenilworth 11261° 0
|Mesaverde 7831 0 Aberdeen 11461° [
Lower Measverc 9611" 0 Spring canyon ?? 0
Castlegate 10442 0 Mancos 11536" 0 TOTAL BHA = 1145.58
Desert 10661° 0 Dakota 16141° 1" Survey 5.1° 14858'
24.00 |Grassy 10841° 0 TD 16675°  545' Survey 5.2 15241"
P/U 285 FLARE DRLG: 2’ TO 4' Deg: ON BKG GAS
SI0 200 FLARE TRIP: NA Gas Buster: ON CONN GAS
JROT. 250 LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 8220
If_U_E_L Used: 900 On Hand: 4050 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS
BIT # 21 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP

[ ConDITIiON




TS rRise s~
Y 7~0i3— 3695

~
G A SC ; GASCO ENERGY GCATE CYyt Sr
M DAILY DRILLING REPORT TIGHT HOLE
RKE 25 AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500’ I Prog.Depth 16650 I DATE 6/2/2008 I DAYS: 72
Current: Operations: DRLG
Depth: 16298’ IProgress 111 lDrlg Hrs: 12 1/2 IAV ROP: 8.9 IFonnatIon: Dakota
DMC: $16,840 ITMC: $418,547 TDC: $45,667 |CWC: $4,106,172
Contractor: Nabor 169 ]Mud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Imw: 12.5 |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit #: 21 C $ - |LocCost: $ -
VIS: 71 |spm: 100 Isize: 77/8 Jsurt. csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 22/35 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FMH3753ZR Int. Csg: $ - |pay work $ 19,500
Gel: 19/34/43]spm: IMFG: SEC Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
wL: 9.4 |lopm: 350 SIN: 11165678 Float Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ 1,827
Cake: 2 Press: 2450 Jets: 6X16 well Head: $ - Water: $ -
PH : 8.6 |avoc: 437 TD Qut: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ -
PHIMF: .3/5.7 |AvDP: 117 Depth In: 16,130 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 815
{Solids: 17.6 |Jetvek: 115 FTG: 168’ Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
Ca : 20  Jeco: 12.75 Hrs: 25 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
|mBT 10 ISPR #: 620@30SPM _|FpPH: 6.7 Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
Chior: 3700 ISPR #2: woB: 10/25 Pumping L/T: $ - {Mud Motors: 3 -
Dapp ppb: 5.9 IBtm.Up min: 83 R-RPM: 50/70 Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: N/A Misc: CMT $ - |Consultant: $ 1,350
START END TIME 558 |7 Total Rot. Hrs: 6940 IDally Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 16,915
6:00 8:30 2:30 DRLG 16187' TO 16204 (17' @ 6.8 FPH ) Misc. / Labor: $ -
8:30 9:00 0:30 DOWN TIME;WORK ON PUMPS Csg. Crew: $ -
9:00 12:30 3:30  JDRLG 16204' TO 16219 (15 @ 4.2FPH) Welding: $ -
12:30 13:00 0:30 SERVICE TOP DRIVE Shaker Screens: $ 1,300
13:00 16:00 3:00 |DRLG 16219' TO 16262 (58' @ 19.3 FPH ) $ -
16:00 17:00 1:00 IDOWN TIME; WORK ON SCR HOUSE $ -
17:00 0:30 7:30 IDRLG 16262' TO 16274(12'@ 1.6 FPH ) |Daily Total: $ 45,667
0:30 1:00 0:30 SERVICE RIG
1:00 6:00 5:00 DRLG 16274" TO 16298 (24' @ 4.8 FPH)
BHA
Py P T T T BIT 1 1.00
nLuCiviey BIT SUB 1 4.00
JUI“I y) 20% |MONEL DC 1 30.75
DC's 14 434.90
HWDP 3 92.18
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING DRLG JARS 31.70
HWDP 18 551.05
JLITHOLOGY: TR% SHALE, 100% SAND
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25" 0 Sunnyside 10981° 0
Wasatch 3681° [ Kenilworth 11261° [
IMesaverde 7831 [} Aberdeen 11461° 0
Lower Measverc 9611" 0 Spring canyon ??? 0"
Castlegate 104420 0O Mancos 11536' 0 TOTAL BHA = 1145.58
Desert 10661 0 Dakota 16141° 0 Survey 5.1° 14858'
24.00 |Grassy 10841° O D 16675 3rr Survey 5.2° 15241
|P/U 285 FLARE DRLG: 2' TO 4' Degasser: ON BKG GAS 700/1800
S/I0 200 FLARE TRIP: Gas Buster: ON CONN GAS 1340
JROT. 250 LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET@ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 4763
Ifyﬂ. Used: 1800 On Hand: 6900 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS
BIT # 21 ICS [e]e5] DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP

I CONDITION




GASC
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DAILY DRILLING REPORT

AFE # 40104

TUS KISE s1b
YF~013— 3A3bgs

7T E

TIGHT HOLE

GATE C¥d S
GPS = 39.855139, -110.2409 /

RKB 25
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth  16500° | Prog.Depth 16650" DATE 6/3/2008 DAYS: 73
Current: Operations: DOWN TINE ; WORK ON PUMPS
Depth: 16314’ IProgress 16 IDrIg Hrs: 3 IAV ROP: 53 IFormation: Dakota
lomc: $7,609 [rmc: $426,156 1DC: $50,920 |cwc: $4,157,092
Contractor: Nabor 169 lMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 12.5 l#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBIt #: 21 22 Conductor: $ Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 623 |spm: 100 Size: 77/8 7718 Surf. Csg: $ Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 21/22 |42 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: FMH3753ZR | MS1388DEE |int. csg: $ Day Work $ 19,500
Gel: 15/22/33|spm: |mFG: SEC ULTERRA |prod Csg: $ Rental Tools: $ 3,960
WL: 9.4 |cpm: 350 SIN: 11165678 4907 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 2450 Jets: 6X16 6X14 Well Head: $ Water: $ -
PH : 86 Javpc: 437 D Out: 16314 TBG/Rods: $ Fuel: $ -
PHMf: .3/5.8 Javbp: 117 Depth In: 16,130 16,314 Packers: $ Mud Logger: $ 815
Isolids: 17.6  lsetvel: 115 FTG: 184 Tanks: $ Logging: $ -
Ca : 20 [ecp: 12.75 Hrs: 37 Separator: $ Cement: $ -
MBT 10 JsPR#1: 620@30SPM _[FPH: 5.0 Heater: $ Bits: $ 10,500
Chior: 3800 ISPR #2: WOB: 10/25 Pumping LIT: $ Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 58 IBtm.Up min: 83 R-RPM: 50/70 Prime Mover: $ Camp $ 7,111
Time Break Down: TotalD.T. |M-RPM: N/A |misc: cmT $ Consultant: $ 1,350
sTART | END TIME 561.5 | Total Rot. Hrs: 706.0  JoaiyTota:  § Drilling Mud: $ 7,684
6:00 9:00 3:00 DRLG 16298' TO 16314' (16' @ 5.3 FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ -
9:00 20:30 11:30 TOOH Csg. Crew: $ -
20:30 21:30 1:00 CHANGE OUT BIT AND TURN WEAR BUSHING ¥ TURN Welding: $ -
21:30 | 23:30 2:00 TIH Ishaker Screens: $ -
23:30 0:30 1:00 CHANGE QUT ROTATING RUBBER $ -
0:30 2:00 1:30 TIH $ -
2:00 2:30 0:30 SERVICE TOP DRIVE |Daily Total: $ 50,920
2:30 6:00 3:30 DOWN TINE ; WORK ON PUMPS
6:00
BHA
BIT 1 1.00
eIl el ol AV iod mY \ BIT SUB 1 4.00
NLLVLIVI-L fvoneLpc | 1 30.75
1IN L2 DC's 14 434.90
bt HWDP 3 92.18
o DRLG JARS 1 31.70
DIV, OF O, GAS & MINING HWDP 18 551.05
LITHOLOGY: TR% SHALE, 100% SAND
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981° 0
Wasatch 3681' 0 Kenilworth 11261 0
|Mesaverde 7831 0 Aberdeen 11461° 0
Lower Measverc 9611° 0 Spring canyon ??2? 0
Castlegate 10442 0 Mancos 11536' 0 TOTAL BHA = 1145.58
Desert 10661° 0 Dakota 16141° 0 Survey 5.1° 14858'
24.00 |Grassy 10841° O D 16675 361 Survey 5.2° 15241
P/U 285 FLARE DRLG: 2' TO 4' Degasser: ON BKG GAS 900/1000
S/I0 200 FLARE TRIP: Gas Buster: ON CONN GAS
IROT. 250 LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 1062
FUEL Used: 1800 On Hand: 6900 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS
BIT # _ 21 ICS 0oCs DC LOC B/S G ODC RP
| CONDITION 1 1 NO A X i NO PR




GASC
Energy

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
AFE # 40104

T8 RIsF /b
43-0l7- 33635

TIGHT HOLE

GHre Cyt' =

GPS 39.855139, -110 240 42

RKB 25'
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth  16500' I Prog.Depth 16650 DATE 6/4/2008 I DAYS: 74
Current: Operations: WORK STUCK PIPE
|Depth:  16314' [Progress 0 |orig Hrs: 0 |av roP: #DIV/O!  [Formation: Dakota
lomc: $10,023 [Tmc: $436,179 TDC: $40,208 |cwc: $4,197,390
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
{mw: 12.8 J#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit #: 22 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 60 |sem: 100 Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: 3$ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 17/21 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: MS1388DEE int. Csg: $ - |paywork $ 19,500
Gel: 15/25/34)sPm: iMFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 3,960
WL: 10.9 JGPMm: 350 IS/N: 4907 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 2450 Jets: 6X14 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 4,575
PH : 8.5 |avbc: 437 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet: $ -
PIMF: .35/6.3 |av pp: 117 Depth In: 16,314 Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 815
Solids: 18.5 |Jetver: 115 FTG: o Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
Ca : 40 |eco: 12.75 Hrs: 0 Iseparator: $ - Cement: $ -
jmeT 7.5 |sPr#1: 620@30SPM_|FPH: #DIV/0! Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
Chior: 4000 |sPR#2: wOoB: 10/25 Pumping LIT: $ - {Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 7 |Btm.Up min: 83 R-RPM: 50/70 Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T.  [M-RPM: N/A |Misc: cMT $ - |Consultant; $§ 1,350
START | END TIME 561.5 | Total Rot. Hrs: 706.0 IDain Total: $ - |oritling Mud: $ 10,098
6:00 9:00 3:00 |TIH Misc. / Labor: $ -
9:00 11:30 2:30 TAG TIGHT SPOT WASH AND REAM 10844' TO 11734 Csg. Crew: $ -
11:30 | 12:00 0:30 _|RIG SERVICE Welding: $ -
12:00 13:00 1:00 TIH ]Shaker Screens: $ -
13:00 15:30 2:30 WASH AND REAM 12946’ TO 14218’ $ -
15:30 | 16:30 1:00__ |miH $ .
16:30 4:30 12:00 JWASH AND REAM 15957' TO 16274 |Daily Total: $ 40,298
6:00 WORK STUCK PIPE
0:00
BHA
BIT 1 1.00
BIT SUB 1 4.00
DN TS MONEL DC 1 30.75
P\ VLD DC's 14 434.90
[ IN‘O“'_ZH% HWDP 3 92.18
o
DRLG JARS 1 31.70
HWDP 18 551.05
DV OF Oi, GAS S MINING
LITHOLOGY: TR% SHALE, 100% SAND
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981" 0"
Wasatch 3681" 0 Kenilworth 11261' [
[Mesaverde 7831’ 0 Aberdeen 11461° 0
Lower Measverc 9611° 0 Spring canyon 2?? [
Castlegate 10442 0 Mancos 11536 0 TOTAL BHA = 1145.58
Desert 10661 0" Dakota 16141° 0 Survey 5.1° 14858’
24.00 |Grassy 10841° 0 TD 16675 361" Survey 5.2° 15241
PV 285 FLAREDRLG: 22 TO 4 Degasser: ON BKG GAS 900/1000
SIO 200 FLARE TRIP: 35' Gas Buster: ON CONN GAS
ROT. 250 LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 3252
IFUEL  Used: 1800  On Hand: 6900 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS
BIT # 22 ICS OCS DC LGOC B/S G ODC RP

[ CONDITION
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(7‘ /1S RISE 54

Gasco Energy

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

wz 3%%’
r[z‘, CYN ST

HT HOLE

AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
RKB 25
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth  16500' I Prog.Depth 16650" DATE 6/5/2008 | DAYS: 75
Current: Operations: WORK STUCK PIPE
|oepth:  16314' |Progress 0 |orig Hrs: 0 |av roP: #DIV/0!  frormation: Dakota
lomc: $29,795 ITMC: $460,746 TDC: 1 $87,296 |cwe: $4,284,686
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Imw: 13.2 #1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBIt #: 22 Condi $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 62 {spwm: 100 ISize: 77/8 fsurf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 18/22 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: MS1388DEE int. Csg: $ - |pay work $ 19,500
Gel: 14/24/33|spm: iMFe: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
wi: 11.2 |ePm: 350 lsm; 4907 Float Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 2450 Jets: 6X14 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
PH : 8.6 Javoc: 437 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ 31,376
P/M: .3/6 _ Jav pp: 117 Depth In: 16,314 Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 815
ISolids: 20.4 Letvel: 115 FTG: Q' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
Ca : 20 ECD: 12.75 Hrs: 0 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
ImBT 10 IsPR#1: 620@30SPM _|FPH: #DIV/0! Heater: $ - Bits: $ -
Chior: 3800 fsPr#2: woB: 10/25 Pumping LIT: $ - |mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 6.1 IBtm.Up min: 83 R-RPM: 50/70 Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ 425
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: N/A |Misc: cMT $ - |Consutant: $ 1,350
START END TIME 561.5 I Total Rot. Hrs: 706.0 JDaIIy Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 29,870
6:00 18:00 12:00 JCONT.TO WORK STUCK PIPE @ 14,280' ( NO SUCCESS ) Misc. / Labor: $ -
18:00 18:30 0:30 MIX AND SPOT 60 BBL DRILL ZONE PILL 30 BBLS OUTSIDE PIPE 30 BBLS INSIDE Csg. Crew: $ -
18:30 3:00 8:30 PUMP 3BBLS OUTSIDE EVERY 30 MIN WORK STUCK PIPE,GAINED 3' TO 5' UP Welding: $ -
3:00 3:30 0:30 MIX & SPOT 60 BBL PIPE LAX & DIESEL PILL 30 BBLS OUT PIPE 30BBLS INSIDE Shaker Screens: $ -
3:30 5:00 1:30 LET PILL SET $ -
5:00 6:00 1:00 PUMP 3 BBLS OUTSIDE PIPE EVERY 30 MINS WORK STUCK PIPE $ -
Daily Total: $ 87,296
BHA
RE(\I:nlcn BIT 1 1.00
L LTV
BIT SUB 1 4.00
1 'N—U§—2008 MONEL DC 1 30.75
o ’ DCs 14 434.90
DRE-OF-DH-GAS & MINING S o
DRLG JARS 1 31.70
HWDP 18 551.05
LITHOLOGY: TR% SHALE, 100% SAND
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981" 0
Wasatch 3681" 0 Kenilworth 11261" 0
|Mesaverde 7831° 0 Aberdeen 11461° 0
Lower Measverc 9611° 0 Spring canyon 2?7 0
Castlegate 10442 O Mancos 11536 0 TOTAL BHA = 1145.58
Desert 10661° 0 Dakota 16141' 0 Survey 5.1° 14858
24.00 |Grassy 10841 0 D 16675 361 Survey 5.2° 15241
|PIU 285 FLARE DRLG: 2' TO 4 Degasser: ON BKG GAS 900/1000
S/0 200 FLARE TRIP: N/A Gas Buster: ON CONN GAS
JIROT. 250 LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET @ 4999" KB PEAK GAS 665
IFUEL Used: 1100 On Hand: 11400 Co.Man  Floyd Mitchell TRIP GAS
BIT# 22 ICS 0OCS DC LOC B/S G oDC RP

[ CONDITION
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Gasco Energy
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

TS R isE S-6
bz~ 0I3~ 234685
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RKB 25' AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 PermitDepth 16500° | Prog.Depth 16650’ DATE 6/9/2008 I DAYS: 79
Current: Operations: DRLG 77/8" HOLE
|pepth:  16422' |Progress 107  |prig Hrs: 24 |av RoP: 45  |rormation: Dakota
DMC: $25,269 |TMC: $532,728 TDC: $50,969 |Jcwc: $4,508,971
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Imw: 13.7 |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit #: 22 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 54  |spm: 104 Size: 77/8 Jsurt. Csg: $ - |RigMove: $ -
pVIYP: 20/25 |#2 naTiONAL 10-P-130 Type: MS1388DEE Int. Csg: $ - |pay work $ 19,500
Gel: 12/28/38}spwm: vFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
WL: 11.6  |GPM: 363 IS/N: 4907 Float Equp: $ - {Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 2850 Jets: 6X14 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
PH : 8.4 Javoc: 450 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ -
PHM: .2/5.8 _JAv op: 120 Depth In: 16,314 Packers: $ - |MudLogger: $ 815
Isolids: 23.6  Jetvel: 96 FTG: 108’ Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
Ca : 40  |eco: 141 Hrs: 25 1/2 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
ImBT 5 ISPR #1: FPH: 4.2 Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
Chior: 4000 ISPR #2: WOB: 10/25 Pumping LIT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 6 IBtm.Up min: 82 MIN  |r-RPM: 50/70 Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [M-RPM: N/A misc: cmr $ - |consuitant: $ 1,350
START | END TIME 561.5 I Total Rot, Hrs: 733.0  {paiy Totar $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 25,344
6:00 6:00 24.00 {DRLG 77/8" HOLE F/16,315' T/16,422' (107" @ 4.5 FPH ) Misc. / Labor: $ -
Csg. Crew: $ -
{Weiding: $ -
|Shaker Screens: $ -
|Daily Total: $ 50,969
RECEIVED
JUN 09 2008 BHA
BIT 1 1.00
BV-OF Oit; INING e -
JMONEL DC 1 30.75
DC's 14 434.90
HWDP 3 92.18
NOTE: HAD 90% RED SHALE ON SAMPLE TAKEN F/16,400' T/16,410' DRLG JARS 1 31.70
HWDP 18 551.05
LITHOLOGY: 90% SHALE, 10% SAND
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25' 0 Sunnyside 10981° 0
\Wasatch 3681° 0 Kenilworth 11261' 0
Mesaverde 7831 [V} Aberdeen 11461' 0
Lower Measverc 9611" 0 Spring canyon 2?7 0
Castlegate 10442 0 Mancos 11536" 0 TOTAL BHA = 1145.58
Desert 10661 0 Dakota 16141° 0 Survey 5.1° 14858'
24.00 |Grassy 10841 0 D 16675 253 Survey 5.2° 15241
P/U 330 FLARE DRLG: 2' TO 6’ Degasser: ON BKG GAS 350/600
S/0 220 FLARE TRIP: N/A Gas Buster:  ON CONN GAS 331
IROT. 318 LAST CSG.RA 95/8 SET@ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 1101
IFUEL Used: 2100 On Hand: 3000 Co.Man  Floyd Mitchell TRIP GAS N/A
BIT# 22 ICS 0OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

[ CONDITION




TS RISE sk

GASGO Gasco Energy 13- A ac’éygii ST
-E*-ﬁ—_—-—‘-’- DAILY DRILLING REPORT TlGH? ﬁOLE
ergy AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
RKB 25'
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500° | Prog.Depth 16650" DATE 6/10/08 DAYS: 80
Current: Operations: TRIP OUT OF HOLE F/BIT #23 (MAGNA FLUX BHA)
|Depth: 16480 lProgress 38 lDrIg Hrs: 9 |]av roP: 4.2 JFormation: Dakota
lomc: $10,574 [tme: $549,715 TDC: $70,676 |cwe: $4,579,647
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
TMw: 13.8 [J#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBIt #: 22 Cond $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 63 |spm: 105 Size: 77/8 Surt. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 22/34 |52 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: MS1388DEE Int. Csg: $ - |paywork $ 19,500
Gel: 15/28/42}spm: JMFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
WL 10.8 |ePm: 366 IS/N: 4907 Float Equp: $ - |rrucking: $ 600
Cake: 2 Press: 2923 Jets: 6X14 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
PH : 8.4 |avpce: 454 TD Out: 16,460 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet $ 32,137
PfiMf: .3/5.9 Jav pp: 121 Depth In: 16,314 Packers: $ - 1Mud Logger: $ 815
{solids: 23.2 |etvel: 97 FTG: 146’ Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
Ca : 40  |ecp: 14.2 Hrs: 34 1/2 Iseparator: $ - Cement: $ -
ImeT 5 ISPR #: FPH: 4.2 Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Chlor: 4000 ISPR #2: wos: 10/25 Pumping LIT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 6.2 IBtm.Up min: 82 MIN R-RPM: 50/70 Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ 1,665
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: N/A Imisc: cMT $ - |consultant: $ 1,350
START END TIME 561.5 I Total Rot. Hrs: 14207 I]Daily Total: $ - |orining Mug: $ 10,649
6:00 13:00 7.00 DRLG 77/8" HOLE F/16,422' T/16,457' (35' @ 5 FPH ) Misc. / Labor: $ -
13:00 13:30 0:50 SERVICE TOP DRIVE Csg. Crew: $ -
13:30 15:30 2:00 DRLG 77/8" HOLE F/16,457' T/16,460'(3' @ 1.5 FPH ) Welding: $ -
15:30 2:30 11:00 JPUMP SLUG TRIP OUT OF HOLE F/BIT # 23 |Shaker Screens: $ -
2:30 6:00 3:50 CONT. TRIP OQUT OF HOLE, MAGNA FLUX BHA ON TRIP OUT
|Daily Total: $ 70,676
HRECEIVED BHA
s _ BIT 1 1.00
JUNTU 2008 BIT SUB 1 4.00
{MONEL DC 1 30.75
DIV, OF QIL, GAS & MINING DC's 14 434.90
HWDP 3 92.18
DRLG JARS 1 31.70
HWDP 18 551.05
JLITHOLOGY: 20% SHALE, 80% SAND
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0" Sunnyside 10981’ 0
Wasatch 3681° 0 Kenilworth 11261' 0
Mesaverde 7831° 0 Aberdeen 11461° 0
Lower Measverc 9611" () Spring canyon ?2?7? 0
Castlegate 10442 O Mancos 11536 0 TOTAL BHA = 1145.58
Desert 10661° 0 Dakota 16141° 0 Survey 5.1° 14858'
24.00 |Grassy 10841 0 D 16675 215 Survey 5.2° 16241
|P/U 330 FLARE DRLG: 2' TO 6' Degasser: ON BKG GAS 300/500
S/0 220 FLARE TRIP: N/A Gas Buster: ON CONN GAS 755
JROT. 318 LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 795
IfHE_L Used: 1800  On Hand: 8700 Co.Man  Floyd Mitchell TRIP GAS N/A
BIT # _ 22 ICS 0OCS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP
| CONDITION




STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

¢ . DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
ML-47067
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS A AOTIEE OR TRIBE A

- 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposais to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to G t C
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals, ate Lanyon

1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
OLwell L] GASWELL W] OTHER Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Gasco Production Company 4301332685
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT,
8 Inverness Dr E, Ste 100 .. Englewood ... Co ..80112 (303) 483-0044 Gate Canyon - Wildcat
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 1895’ FSL & 2007' FWL county: Duchesne
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NESW 16  11S  15E STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT L [
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING [T] FrACTURE TREAT [] siETRACK TO REPAR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [ ] casiNG REPAR [ 1 ~ewconsTRUCTION [] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[ cHaNGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [[] oPeraTor cHANGE [] tuswGRePAR
|:| CHANGE TUBING D PLUG AND ABANDON D VENT OR FLARE
] suBSEQUENT REPORT [] cHanGe weLL name [] puseack [7] wateroisposaL
(Submit Original Form Only}
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) D WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:
[[] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE ] omexr
[] converTweLL TYpe [] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12, DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

This well is currently permitted to 16,500'. Geological horizons are coming in deeper than anticipated, so we expect to td this
well at 16,650 instead.

COPY SENT TO OPERATOR

Date: #1]7¢ w
Initials:__ &S

NAME (PLEASE/PRINT) Beverly Walker TITLE Englneerlng Technician

SIGNATuriE\TD(’ ¢ x,Lnf LQ olls. pate _0/5/2008

APPROVED BY-THESTATE —EETVED
{This space for State use only) OF UTA"" DlV|S|ON OF i RE(II:JV

OlL, GAS ?D MINING * JUN 06 2008
DATE %- PANII)) F‘; DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING

(5/2000) )
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AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
RKB 25'
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500° | Prog.Depth 16650" DATE 6/11/08 DAYS: 81
Current: Operations: STAGE IN HOLE W/BIT #23
Depth: 16460’ lProgress 0 lDrlg Hrs: 4] IAV ROP: #DIV/0! IFormaﬂon: Dakota
lomc: $8,936 {Tmc: $558,652 TDC: $43,886 |cwo: $4,623,533
Contractor: Nabor 168 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 13.8 [#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBIt #: 22 23 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 67 {sPm: 105 ISlze: 778 77/8 Surt. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
pVIYP: 22/36 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: MS1388DEE F59Y int. Csg: $ - |paywork $ 19,500
Gel: 18/32/41|sPm: |mFG: ULTERRA STC Prod Csg: $ - [Rental Tools: $ 3,960
Wi 10.8 |GPM: 366 SIN: 4907 PD3485  |Ficat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 2923 Jets: 6X14 3X28 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 5,705
PH : 8.5 {avopc: 454 TD Out: 16,460 TBG/Rods: $ - [Fuet: $ -
PHMf: .3/5.8 |avpP: 121 Depth In: 16,314 16,460'  |Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 815
ISolids: 24.0 Joetvel: 97 FTG: 146" Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
Ca : 40 |eco: 14.2 Hrs: 34 1/2 |separator: $ - Cement: $ -
{meT 75 |sPr: FPH: 4.2 Heater: $ - |gits: $ -
Chlor: 3900 |sPr#2: WOB: 10/25 Pumping LIT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 5.8  |Btm.Up min: 82 MIN  |r-RPM: 50/70 Prime Mover: $ - |camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: N/A Misc: CMT $ - |Consultant: $ 1,350
START | END TIME 561.5 | Total Rot. Hrs: 7420 |paiytoa:  $ - |oriling Mu: $ 9,011
6:00 9:00 3.00 CONT T/TRIP OUT OF INSPECTING BHA Misc. / Labor: $ 3,545
9:00 9:30 0:50 PULL WEAR BUSHING Csg. Crew: $ -
9:30 10:00 0:50 SERVICE TOP DRIVE Welding: $ -
10:00 14:30 4:50 CUT & SLIP DRILLING LINE { WORK ON WASH PIPE ) Shaker Screens: $ -
14:30 15:00 0:50 INSTALL NEW WEAR BUSHING IN WELLHEAD
15:00 16:00 1:00 P/U 3-6 1/4" DCS OFF RACKS, M/U BIT # 23
16:00 20:30 4:50 TRIP IN HOLE T/CSG SHOE Daily Total: $ 43,886
20:30 21:00 0:50 FILL PIPE
2100 22:30 1:50 CONT TRIP IN HOLE T/8000'
22:30 23:30 1:00 FILL PIPE, CIRC OUT GAS COND HOLE & MUD
23:30 1:30 2:00 CONT. TRIP IN HOLE T/12,000° BHA
1:30 3:00 1:50 FILL PIPE, CIRC OUT GAS COND HOLE & MUD BIT 1 1.00
3:00 3:30 0:50 CONT. TRIP IN HOLE T/13,000 BIT SUB 1 4.00
3:30 5.00 1:50 FILL PIPE, CIRC OUT GAS COND HOLE & MUD DCS 15 466.10
5.00 6:00 1:00 CONT. TRIP IN HOLE HWDP 3 92.20
DRLG JARS 1 31.90
HWDP 18 551.90
NOTE:ON BHA INSPECTION LAYED DOWN 2-61/4" DCS W/DAMAGED FACES & 1
61/4" MONEL DC W/ICRACKED BOX [ e P .
NECHEHIVED :
LITHOLOGY: 20% SHALE, 80% SAND i « L an
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go JPUIN lUUB ;
Green River 25° o Sunnyside 10981 0 ;
|[Wasatch 3681" o Kenilworth 11261° o uiv. OF O, L, Glt s & M_[NJN_G
Mesaverde 7831 0 Aberdeen 11461° 0
Lower Measverc 9611° 0 Spring canyon 2?2? 0"
Castlegate 10442' 0O Mancos 11536 [} TOTAL BHA = 114710
Desert 10661° 0 Dakota 16141" 0 Survey 5.1° 14858'
24.00 |Grassy 10841 0O T 16675' 215 Survey 5.20 15241
IPlU 330 FLARE DRLG: N/A Degasser: ON BKG GAS N/A
S/IO 220 FLARE TRIP: 20'TO 25' Gas Buster: ON CONN GAS N/A
IROT. 318 LAST CSG.RA 95/8 SET@ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 480
liEl.' Used: 900 On Hand: 7800 Co.llll_an Floyd Mitchell TRIP GAS 480
BIT# _22 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP
| CONDITION
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RKB 25' AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth  16500° | Prog.Depth 16650 I DATE 6/12/08 DAYS: 82
|Current: Operations: DRLG 77/8" HOLE
lDepth: 16522' |Progres 62 IDrIg Hrs: 19 1/2 |AV ROP: 3.2 IFormaﬁon: Dakota
Ipmc: $10,885 [mc: $568,667 TDC: $36,585 fcwe: $4,660,118
IContractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
aw: 13.8 |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Ians: 22 23 Conductor: $ - |roc,Cost: $ -
vis: 61 ISPM: 109 Istze: 778 77/8 |surt csg: $ - |rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 22/28 NATIONAL 10-P130 " |rype: MS1388DEE F59Y it csg: $ - |pay work $ 19,500
lce: 14/28/39]spwm: jvrc: ULTERRA STC Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
IWL: 114 |cPm: 380 S/N: 4907 PD3485  |Fioat Equp: $ = |Trucki $ -
Cake: 2 IPress: 2960 Jets: 6X14 3 X 28  |wellHead: $ - lwater: $ -
PH : 8.5 javpc: 471 TD Out: 16,460 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
PHME: .3/6.4 Javoe: 126 Depth In: 16,314 16,460' |Ip $ - |Mud Logger: $ 815
Sofids: 24.4 igetvm: 101 FTG: 146' 62' Tanks: $ - |togging: $ -
Ca : 40 _Jeco: 14.2 Hrs: 34112 19 1/2___|separator: $ - |cement: $ -
MBT 10 lser#n: FPH: 4.2 3.2 Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
Chior: 4000 ISPR #2: jwos: 10/25 40/47 _ lpumpingLr:  § - |Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 6.2 IBtm.Up min: 79 MINJR-RPM: 50/70 70/80 Prime Mover: $ - |camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM—RPM: N/A N/A [Misc: CMT $ - |Consuitant: $ 1,350
START | END TIME 561.5 I Total Rot. Hrs: 761.5  |pany Totar $ - |pritiing Mud: $ 10,960
6:00 7:00 1.00 CONT. T/TRIP IN HOLE T/16,222' Misc. / Labor: $ -
7:00 10:00 3:00 JFILL PIPE WASH & REAM F/16,222' T/16,460' Csg. Crew: $ -
10:00 16:00 6:00 IDRLG 77/8° HOLE F/16,460' T/16,480' (20' @ 3.3 FPH ) JWeldi $ -
16:00 | 16:30 | 0:50 JSERVICE TOP DRIVE sheer scroens: $ -
16:30 6:00 13:50 IDRLG 77/8" HOLE F/16,480' T/16,522' (42' @ 3.1 FPH )
|Daily Total: $ 36,585
BHA
RN I r BIT 1 1.00
e e el d BIT SUB 1 4.00
[TREE] D 9 DCS 15 466.10
T & HWDP 3 92.20
. . - DRLG JARS 1 31.90
AW NP 11 1)L — 18 551.90
JLITHOLOGY: 90% SHALE, 10% SAND, TR COAL
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 (3 Sunnyside 10981 @
|Wasatch 3681 0 Kenilworth 11261° [
IMesaverde 7831° 0 Aberdeen 11481° 0
Lower Measverc __ 9611° 0 Spring canyon ??7? 0
Castlegate 10442° O Mancos 11536’ 0 TOTAL BHA = 1147.10
JDesert 10661° O Dakota 16141° 0 |Survey 5.1° 14858'
24.00 |Grassy 10841° 0O ™ 16675 153 [survey 5.2° 15241'
P/Y 330 FLARE DRLG: 2'TO &' Degasser: ON BKG GAS 300/3%0
HSIO 220 FLARE TRIP: 20'TO 25" Gas Buster: ON CONN GAS 420
IROT. 318 LAST CSG.RA 958 SET@ _ 4999'KB PEAK GAS 2577
IFUEL _ Used: 1950 OnHand: _ 5850 Co.Man__ Floyd Mitchell TRIP GAS 2577
BIT# 22 ICS 0OCS pC LOC B/S G ODC RP
CONDITION 2 2 CT A X | WT PR
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GASC GASCO ENERGY 19(4;4 7 YA S
Fnerov DAILY DRILLING REPORT | i—IT HOLE
g} RKE 25 AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth  16500" | Prog.Depth 16610° | DATE 6/13/08 | DAYS: 83
Current: Operations: DRLG 77/8" HOLE
Depth: 16589 IProgress 67 IDrIg Hrs: 22 IAV ROP: 3.0 lFormation: Dakota
DMC: $12,484 }TMC: $581,011 TDC: $76,643 Jcwc: $4,736,761
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
faw: 13.8 {#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 [eres: 23 Conductor: $ - {Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 64 [spm: 112 Size: 77/8 {surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 27/35 |#2 waTIONAL 10-P-130 Type: F59Y int. Csg: $ - |pay work $ 19,500
Get: 16/33/46]spm: |mrFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
wL: 9.4 |epm: 390 SIN: PD3485 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 665
Cake: 2 Press: 3172 Jets: 3X28 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
PH : 8.5 Javbc: 484 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel: $ 37,164
PHIMF: .3/5.9 |avop: 129 Depth In: 16,460 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 815
|sotids: 22.0 |uetvel: 104 FTG: 129 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
Ca : 40  |ecop: 14.2 Hrs: 41 1/2 |Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
ImeT 7.5 lSPR #1: FPH: 3.1 Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
Chior: 4000 ISPR #2: wos: 45/55 Pumping LIT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 5.9 IBtm.Up min: 77 MIN R-RPM: 50/70 Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ 630
Time Break Down: Total D.T.  |M-RPM: N/A JMisc: cMT $ - jConsultant: $ 1350
START | END TIME 561.5 I Total Rot. Hrs: 761.5 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 12,559
6:00 10:00 4.00 DRLG 77/8" HOLE F/16,522' T/16,536' (14' @ 3.5 FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ -
10:00 | 10:30 0:50 _ |SERVICE RIG Csg. Crew: $ -
10:30 13:30 3:00 DRLG 77/8" HOLE F/16,536' T/16,540' (4 @ 1.3FPH) Welding: $ -
13:30 14:00 0:50 WORK ON MUD PUMPS Shaker Screens: $ -
14.00 14:30 0:50 DRLG 77/8" HOLE 16,540' 7/16,545' (5' @ 10 FPH )
14:30 | 15:00 0:50 WORK ON MUD PUMPS
15:00 | 23:30 8:50 DRLG 77/8" HOLE F/16,545' T/16,577'( 32' @ 3.7 FPH ) |Daily Total: $ 76,643
23:30 0:00 0:50 WORK ON MUD PUMPS
0:00 6:00 6:00 |DRLG 77/8" HOLE F/16,577' T/16,589' (12’ @ 2 FPH )
BHA
BIT 1 1.00
RECEIVED BIT SUB 1 4.00
DCS 15 466.10
JUN 1.3 2008 HWDP 3 92.20
DRLG JARS 31.90
Ny OF (’}”_’ GAS & M!N!NG HWDP 18 551.90
LITHOLOGY: 90% SHALE, 10% SAND, TR COAL
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981° 0
|Wasatch 3681" 0 Kenilworth 11261° [0
Mesaverde 7831 0 Aberdeen 11461 0
Lower Measverc 9611° 0 Spring canyon ??7? 0
Castlegate 10442 0’ Mancos 11536' 0 TOTAL BHA = 1147.10
Desert 10661° 0" Dakota 16141° 0" Survey 5.1° 14858'
24.00 |Grassy 10841 O ™ 16610° 21 Survey 5.2° 15241
Ipiu 330 FLARE DRLG: 2’ TO 5 Degasser: ON BKG GAS 200/400
SI0 220 FLARE TRIP: N/A Gas Buster: ON CONN GAS 409
1IROT. 310 LAST CSG.RA 95/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 755
Iﬂ.l_ﬂ. Used: On Hand: 11,100 Co.Man Floyd Mitchell TRIP GAS N/A
BIT # 23 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

[ CONDITION
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RKB 25 AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth  16500° | Prog.Depth 16610° DATE 6/16/08 DAYS: 86
Current: Operations: TRIP IN HOLE (CLEAN OUT RUN F/LOGS)
Depth: 16610’ IProgress 21 IDrlg Hrs: 10 IAV ROP: 21 IFormatlon: Dakota
DMC: $5,048 [tmc: $602,052 TDC: $31,4904 |cwe: $4,868,054
Contractor: Nabor 169 lMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
{Mw: 14 |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit # 24 RR c $ - |rocCost: $ -
vis: 75 |sem: 197 size: 77/8 Ysurt. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 35/33 |#2 nATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: F59Y int. Csg: $ - |pay work $ 19,500
Gel: 19/33/44]spm: |mre: STC Prod Csg: $ - |Rentai Tools: $ 3,960
WL 9.5 lGPm: 373 SIN: PD3485 Fioat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 3056 Jets: 3X28 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
PH : 8.5 Javbc: 463 D Out: 16,610 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet: $ -
PHME: A4/6.1_{avpp: 124 Depth In: 16610° Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 815
Solids: 24.3  JJetvel: 99 FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
Ca : 20 |eco: 14.3 Hrs: Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
MBT 7.5 |sPr#1: FPH: #VALUE! Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
Chior: 4100 |sPR#2: WoB: P Ln: $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 6.5 |Btm.Up min: 81 MIN R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ 746
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: N/A [Misc: cMT $ - |Consultant: $ 1,350
START END TIME 561.5 I Total Rot. Hrs: 771.5 IDaily Total: $ - |orilting Mud: $ 5123
6:00 9:00 3.00 CONT. T/LOG WELL W/BAKER ATLAS, RUN #2 Misc. / Labor: $ -
9:00 10:00 1:00 RIG DOWN LOGGING EQUIPMENT Csg. Crew: $ -
10:00 13:30 3:50 M/U BIT & BIT SUB TRIP IN HOLE T/SHOE Welding: $ -
13:30 14:00 0:50 SERVICE TOP DRIVE Shaker Screens: $ -
14.00 14:30 0:50 INSTALL ROTATING HEAD
14:30 3:00 12:50 JWASH & REAM TIGHT HOLE F/5000" T/5485' ( PUMP HI VIS SWEEP )
3:00 3:30 0:50 TRIP OUT OF HOLE T/CSG SHOE ( OK ) IDaily Total: $ 31,494
3:30 6:00 2:50 CONT. TRIP IN HOLE ( CURRENTLY @ 9500" )
BHA
RECEIVED BIT 1 1.00
- BIT SUB 1 4.00
AUN 1 8 2008 oes 15 466.10
HWDP, 3 92.20
DREOF CIL- GAS 2 MINING DRLOARS}— 2L
HWDP 18 551.90
LITHOLOGY: 100% SHALE
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981" 0
Wasatch 3681° 0 Kenilworth 11261' [
|Mesaverde 7831° 0 Aberdeen 11461° 0
Lower Measverc 9611" 0 Spring canyon 2?7? 0
Castlegate 10442 0 Mancos 11536 0 TOTAL BHA = 1147.10
Desert 10661 0 Dakota 16141° 0 Survey 5.1° 14858'
24.00 {Grassy 10841'° 0 D 16610 0 Survey 5.2° 15241'
1PIU FLARE DRLG: N/A Degasser: ON BKG GAS 200/500
S/0 FLARE TRIP: N/A Gas Buster: ON CONN GAS N/A
ROT. LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET@ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 310
%L Used: 1350 On Hand: 7,350 Co.Man Floyd Mitchell TRIP GAS 310
BIT# 24RR ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP

[ CONDITION
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AFE # 40104

Ti

GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942

RKB 25'
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500’ I Prog.Depth 16610’ DATE 6/17/08 DAYS: 87
Current: Operations: CIRC. & COND HOLE F/TRIP OUT F/LOGS
Depth: 16610 IProgress 0 IDrIg Hrs: 0 IAV ROP: #DIV/O! IFormation: Dakota
lomc: $8,586 [rmc: $611,438 TDC: $34,286  |cwc: $4,902,340
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
aw: 14  |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBIt #: 24 RR Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
vIS: 68 |spm: 107 Size: 77/8 |surt. csq: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
pVIYE: 31/30 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: F59Y Int. Csg: $ - |paywork $ 19,500
Gel: 17/36/44}spm: |mFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
WL 10.9 JepPm: 373 SIN: PD3485 Float Equp: $ - |trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 2910 Jets: 3 X28 \Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
PH : 8.5 |avpc: 463 7D Out: 16,610 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ -
PMf: .5/6.2_|avop: 124 Depth In: 16610 Packers: $ - _|Mud Logger: $ 815
Sofids: 24.8 |setver 99 FTG: Tanks: $ - |togging: $ -
Ca : 40  |eco: 14.3 Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
MBT 7.5 IsPR#1: FPH: #VALUE! Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
Chior: 4100 |spr#2: wOB: Pumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 5.5  |Btm.Up min: 81 MIN  |rRrPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. iM—RPM: N/A |misc: cmT $ - Consultant: $ 1,350
START | END TIME 561.5 I Total Rot. Hrs: 771.5 IDally Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 8661
6:00 7:30 1.50 CONT. CIRC. OUT GAS, COND HOLE & MUD @ 9500 Misc. / Labor: $ -
7:30 10:00 2:50 CONT. TRIP IN HOLE T/13,000' Csg. Crew: $ -
10:00 12:00 2:00 FILL PIPE CIRC OUT GAS, COND HOLE & MUD Welding: $ -
12:00 14:30 2:50 CONT. TRIP IN HOLE T/15,700' Sh Screens: 3 -
14:30 4:30 14:00 |WASH & REAM TIGHT HOLE F/15,700' T/16,610"
4:30 6:00 1:50 CIRC. & COND HOLE F/TRIP OUT F/LOGS
{Daily Total: $ 34,286
[onY e S e B W 1l ¥
nEUEIvVED
NI 7
JUN 17 Zﬂﬁs BHA
BIT 1 1.00
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING BIT SUB 1 4.00
DCS 15 466.10
HWDP 3 92.20
DRLG JARS 1 31.90
INOTE: ON CIRCULATION OUT @ 13,000' 1" TO 1 3/4" DIAMETER x 1/4" TO 1/2" HWDP 18 551.90
THICK RED SHALE CAME OVER SHALE SHAKER
LITHOLOGY: 100% SHALE
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25' 0 Sunnyside 10981 0
Wasatch 3e81° [ Kenilworth 11261 4
|Mesaverde 7831° 0 Aberdeen 11461 o
Lower Measverc 9611° 0 Spring canyon 2?77 0
Castlegate 10442 0 Mancos 11536 0 TOTAL BHA = 1147.10
Desert 10661° 0 Dakota 16141" 0 Survey 5.1° 14858'
24.00 |Grassy 10841° 0 ™ 16610° @ Survey 5.2° 15247
P/U FLARE DRLG: N/A Degasser: ON BKG GAS 200/500
S/IO FLARE TRIP: 20'TO 30' Gas Buster: ON CONN GAS N/A
ROT. LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 4897
EL Used: 1500 On Hand: 5,850 Co.Man  Floyd Mitchell TRIP GAS 4897
BIT# 24RR ICS OCSs DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

[ CONDITION
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RKB 25' AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth  16500' | Prog.Depth 16610' I DATE 6/18/08 I DAYS: 88
Current: Operations: LOGGING WELL W/BAKER ATLAS ( STAR IMAGER )
|pepth:  16610" |Progress 0 Jorig Hrs: 0 |av ROP: #DIV/O!  [Formation: Dakota
DMC: $19,174 |TMC: $631,412 TDC: $52,750 jCwC: $4,955,090
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
|maw: 14 J#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit # 24 RR Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 69 JSPM: 107 Size: 778 ISurf. Csa: $ - Rig Move: $ -
pVIYP: 28/26 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: F59Y int. Csg: $ - |pay work $ 19,500
Gel: 16/29/40]spm: |MFa: STC Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
WL 10.5 |lepMm: 373 SIN: PD3485 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 2910 Jets: 3 X28 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 7,246
PH : 8.5 |avoc: 463 TD Out: 16,610 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
PMF: .4/6 |avDP: 124 Depth In: 16610’ Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 815
1Solids: 24.7 |Jetvel: 99 FTG: Tanks: $ - ___|Logging: $ -
Ca : 20  JecD: 14.3 Hrs: Separator: $ - {Cement: $ -
mBY 7.5 |IsPR#1: FPH: #VALUE! Heater: $ - |gits: $ -
Chior: 3900 Jspr#2: WOB: Pumping L/T: $ - iMud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 6 ]Btm.Up min: 81 MIN R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ 630
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |MRPM: N/A [Misc: CMT $ - |consultant: $ 1,350
START | END TIME 561.5 I Total Rot, Hrs: 771.5 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 19,249
6:00 7:30 1.50 CONT. TO CIRC & COND HOLE F/LOGS Misc. / Labor: $ -
7:30 20:30 13:00 |PUMP SLUG TRIP OUT OF HOLE F/LOGS Csg. Crew: $ -
20:30 6:00 9:50 R/U LOGGING TOOLS RiH W/STAR IMAGER LOG, LOG WELL ( RUN # 3) Welding: $ -
|Shaker Screens: $ bl
|Daily Total: $ 52,750
RECEIVED
BHA
il IN_l_g_zggs BIT 1 1.00
i BIT SUB 1 4.00
BN-OF Ol GAS S ocs N
HWDP 3 92.20
DRLG JARS 1 31.90
HWDP 18 551.90
INOTE: LOGGERS TD W/RUN # 3 ( STAR IMAGER - 16,200" ) CURRENTLY @ 14,000"
LOGGING UP
JLITHOLOGY: 100% SHALE
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981° 0
Wasatch 3681" 0 Kenilworth 11261’ 0
|Mesaverde 7831" 0 Aberdeen 11461 0
Lower Measverc 9611° 0 Spring canyon 77?7 0
Castlegate 10442° 0" Mancos 11536 0 TOTAL BHA = 1147.10
[Desert 10661° 0 Dakota 16141° 0 Survey 5.1° 14858’
24.00 IGrassy 10841° 0 D 16610 0 Survey 5.2° 15241'
P/U FLARE DRLG: N/A Degasser: ON BKG GAS 200/500
SI0 FLARE TRIP: N/A Gas Buster: ON CONN GAS N/A
|ROT. LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET@ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 1764
If!E_L Used: 1500 On Hand: 5,850 Co.Man  Floyd Mitchell TRIP GAS 1764
BIT# 24RR ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G 0oDC RP

[ CcoNDITION
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TIGHT HOLE

RKB 25 AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500' | Prog.Depth 16610’ DATE 6/19/08 DAYS: 89
Current: Operations: LOGGING WELL W/BAKER ATLAS (MREX & FLEX)
Depth: 16610’ IProgress 0 IDrIg Hrs: 0 |AV ROP: #DIV/O! IFormation: Dakota
DMC: $1,662 ITMC: $633,074 TDC: $63,542 |CwC: $5,018,632
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Imw: 14 J#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit # 24 RR Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 69 |spm: 107 Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 28/26 42 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: F59Y int. Csg: $ - |paywork $ 19,500
Gel: 16/29/40]spm: MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
WL: 10.5 JePM: 373 SIN: PD3485 Float Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 2910 Jets: 3X28 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
PH : 8.5 lavoc: 463 TD Out: 16,610 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ 31,835
PfIMF: .4/6 _|avDP: 124 Depth In: 16610' Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 815
Isolids: 24.7  |yetver: 99 FTG: Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
Ca : 20 ECD: 14.3 Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
MBT 7.5 |IsPR#1: FPH: #VALUE! Heater: $ - Bits: $ -
Chior: 3900 |sPr#2: WOB: Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 6 Btm.Up min: 81 MIN R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ 495
Time Break Down: TotalD.T.  M-RPM: N/A Misc: CMT $ - |Consultant: $ 1350
START | END TIME 561.5 ] Total Rot. Hrs: 7715 IDaily Total: $ - |oriing Mud: $ 1,662
6:00 | 18:00 12:00 JRUN LOGS STAR IMAGER Misc. / Labor: $ 1,000
18:00 6:00 12:00 RUN LOGS MREX & FLEX (TAG BRIDGE AT 5200' WORK THUR ) Csg. Crew: $ -
6:00 LOGGING @ 15280" TO 13580' Welding: $ -
0:00 Ishaker Screens: $ 2925
0:00
0:00
0:00 |Daily Total: $ 63,542
0:00
0:00
0:00 P W el om N el & W 4 s Y
0-00 neuCcCivioy BHA
0:00 wi BIT 1 1.00
0:00 JU BIT SUB 1 4.00
0:00 DCS 15 466.10
0:00 I, OF OIL, WAS & MINING HWDP 3 92,20
0:00 DRLG JARS 1 31.90
0:00 HWDP 18 551.90
INOTE: LOGGERS TD W/RUN # 3 ( STAR IMAGER - 16,200' ) CURRENTLY @ 14,000’
ILOGGING UP
LITHOLOGY: 100% SHALE
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981° 0
Wasatch 3681° 0 Kenilworth 11261’ 0
|Mesaverde 7831 0 Aberdeen 11461’ 0
Lower Measverc 9611° 0 Spring canyon 2?77 0
Castlegate 10442° O Mancos 11536 0 TOTAL BHA = 1147.10
Desert 10661 0 Dakota 16141 0 Survey 5.1° 14858'
24.00 |erassy 10841 0 1D 16610° 0 Survey 5.2° 15241"
IP/U FLARE DRLG: N/A Degasser: ON BKG GAS 200/500
S/IO FLARE TRIP: N/A Gas Buster:  ON CONN GAS N/A
IROT. LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 1764
IFUEL Used: 1200  On Hand: 4,650 Co.Man  Scott Alired TRIP GAS 1764
BIT# 24RR ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

[ CONDITION
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AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
RKB 25'
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500’ Prog.Depth 16610° DATE 6/20/08 DAYS: 90
Current: Operations: TIH AND INSTALL ROTATING RUBBER
Depth: 16610 IProgress 0 IDrIg Hrs: 0 IAV ROP: #DIV/O! IFormation: Dakota
DMC: $1,200 |TMC: $634,274 TDC: $232,383 |CWC: $5,251,015
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 14 |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit # 24 RR Conductor: $ Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 69 |spm: 107 Size: 778 Surf. Csg: $ Rig Move: $ -
pVIYP: 28/26 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: F59Y Int. Csg: $ Day Work $ 19,500
Gel: 16/29/40|spm: |mrG: STC Prod Csg: $ Rental Tools: $ 3,960
wL: 10.5 |oPM: 373 SIN: PD3485 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 2910 Jets: 3X28 Well Head: $ Water: $ -
PH : 8.5 |avoc: 463 TD Out: 16,610 TBG/Rods: $ Fuel: $ -
PHME: .46 |av pp: 124 Depth In: 16610’ Packers: $ Mud Logger:_ $ 815
Solids: 24.7 letvek 99 FTG: Tanks: $ Logging: $ 150,663
Ca : 20 ECD: 14.3 Hrs: Separator: $ Cement: $ -
ImBT 7.5 |sPrR#1: FPH: #VALUE! Heater: $ Bits: $ -
Chlor: 3900 |sPr#2: woB: Pumping L/T: $ Mud Motors: $ 52,525
Dapp ppb: 6 |Btm.Up min: 81 MIN R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ Camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T.  [M-RPM: N/A |misc: cmT $ - |consuitant: $ 1,350
START | END TIME 561.5 I Total Rot. Hrs: 771.5 IDain Total: $ - |pritling Mug: $ 1,200
6:00 1:30 19:30 RUN LOGS MREX & FLEX (13580" TO 2200} RD LOGGING UNIT Misc. / Labor: $ 2,370
1:30 6:00 4:30 TIH TO SHOE, INSTALL ROTATING RUBBER Csg. Crew: $ -
6:00 Welding: $ -
0:00 Shaker Screens: $ -
0:00
0:00
0:00 Daily Total: $ 232,383
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 BHA
0:00 BIT 1 1.00
0:00 BIT SUB 1 4.00
0:00 HECEIVED MOMEL 1 31.00
0:00 DCS 15 466.10
0:00 JUN LU ZUUB HWDP. 3 92.20
0:00 DRLG JARS 31.90
DIV, OF Ol GAS & MINING HWDP 18 551.90
LITHOLOGY: 100% SHALE
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981’ 0
Wasatch 3681° 0 Kenilworth 11261 o
Mesaverde 7831° [ Aberdeen 11461' 0
Lower Measverc 9611" [ Spring canyon ??7? 0
Castlegate 10442 (O Mancos 11536° 0 TOTAL BHA = 1178.10
Desert 10661 0 Dakota 16141° 0 Survey 5.1° 14858'
24,00 |Grassy 10841 O ™ 16610° 0 Survey 520 15241
|P/U FLARE DRLG: N/A Deg ON BKG GAS 0
SIO FLARE TRIP: N/A Gas Buster: ON CONN GAS 0
ROT. LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET@ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 0
EL Used: 600 On Hand: 10,650 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS 0
BIT# 24RR ICS 0OCS DC LOC B/S G 0oDC RP

[ CONDITION
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RKE 25 AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 PermitDepth 16500’ | Prog.Depth 16610’ DATE 6/23/08 DAYS: 93
Current: Operations: TRIP OUT LAY DOWN DRLL PIPE
Depth: 16610’ |Progress 0 IDrIg Hrs: 0 |AV ROP: #DIV/0! IFormation: Dakota
DMC: $10,495 |Tme: $664,448 TDC: $36,120 |cwc: $5,359,485
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Imw: 14.1 |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBIt # 24 RR Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 87 |spm: 107 Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 41/38 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: F59Y Int. Csg: $ - |paywork $ 19,500
Gel: 20/33/41|spm: |meG: STC Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
WL 9.2 JGPMm: 373 SIN: PD3485 Float Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 2910 Jets: 3X28 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
PH : 8.5 lavoc: 463 TD Out: 16,610 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet $ -
PHME: .4/5.9 {avop: 124 Depth In: 16610’ Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 815
Solids: 24.7  Retvel: 99 FTG: Tanks: $ - |togging: $ -
Ca : 40  Jecp: 14.3 Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
ImeT 7.5 JsPr#1: FPH: #VALUE! Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
Chlor: 4000 JsPr#2: woB: Pumping L/T: $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 5.5 |Btm.Up min: 81 MIN  |rRRPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: N/A |misc: cMT $ - |consuitant: $ 1,350
START END TIME 579.5 I Total Rot. Hrs: 7715 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 10,495
6:00 9:00 3:00 DOWN TIME; PULL TO SHOE HAVE WELDER WORK ON WASH PIPE TIH Misc. / Labor: $ -
9:00 11:30 2:30 REAM BACK TO BOTTOM Csg. Crew: $ -
11:30 15:30 4:00 CIRC. AND COND HOLE FOR SHORT TRIP Welding: $ -
15:30 20:00 4:30 TOOH AND BACK IN FOR A 20 STD SHORT TRIP TAG TIGHT SPOT @ 16200( NO FILL) Shaker Screens: $ -
20:00 3:00 7:00 CIRC. AND COND HOLE FOR CASING, PUMP PILL AND DROP SURVEY
3:00 6:00 3:00 TOOH LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE
6:00 |Daily Total: $ 36,120
0:00
BHA
BIT 1 1.00
[ Y el N eoed AW 4 ol . BIT SUB 1 4.00
NL-WLIvio [mowmeL 1 31.00
1LIAL 2 .2 DCS 15 466.10
FUN-2-3-2668 HWDP 3 92.20
it e et et o as DRLG JARS 1 31.90
DIV OF O GAS S MINING HWoP 18 551.90
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981’ o
Wasatch 3681° 0 Kenilworth 11261 0
|Mesaverde 7831° 0 Aberdeen 11461 0
Lower Measverc 9611° o Spring canyon ?27? 0
Castlegate 10442 0 Mancos 11536’ 0 TOTAL BHA = 1178.10
JDesert 10661" 0 Dakota 16141° 0 Survey 5.1° 14858'
24.00 IGrassy 10841° 0 TD 16610 0 Survey 5.2° 15241
P/U FLARE DRLG: N/A Deg OFF BKG GAS 0
S/0 FLARE TRIP: 15/20 Gas Buster: ON CONN GAS 780
{ROT. LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET@ 4999’ KB PEAK GAS 1975
lFUEL Used: 1275 On Hand: 9,375 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS 1975
BIT# 24RR ICS 0OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

[ CONDITION
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TIGHT HOLE

RKB 25 AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth  16500° | Prog.Depth 1 6_61 0 DATE 6/24/08 DAYS: 94
Current: Operations: RUN 5'2 CASING
[pepth:  16610" JProgress 0 IDrIg Hrs: 0 Jav rRoP: #DIV/O! lFormation: Dakota
lomc: $16,083 [rmc: $681,431 TDC: $565,960 |cwc: $5,925,445
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
TMw: 14.1 |#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit #: 24 RR Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
viS: 87 |spm: 107 ISize: 7718 |surt. csa: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 41/38 |#2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: F59Y int. Csg: $ - |paywork $ 19,500
Gel: 20/33/41|sPm: IvFa: STC Prod Csg: $ 497,760 IRental Tools: $ 3,960
WL 9.2 |opm: 373 SIN: PD3485 Fioat Equp: $ 25,042 |Trucking: $ 550
Cake: 2 Press: 2910 Jets: 3X28 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
PH : 8.5 |avoc: 463 TD Out: 16,610 TBG/Rods: $ - IFuer $ -
PHIME: 4/5.9 |avop: 124 Depth in: 16610' Packers: $ - IMud Logger: $ 815
Isolids: 24.7 etvel: 99 FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
Ca : 40 [eco: 14.3 Hrs: {Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
fuBT 7.5 |sPr#1: FPH: #VALUE! Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
Chior: 4000 |sPr#2: WOB: Pumping L/T: $ - [Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 5.5 IBtm.Up min: 81 MIN R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T.  [M-RPM: N/A JMisc: cMT $ - |Consultant: $ 1,350
START END TIME 579.5 | Total Rot. Hrs: 7715 IDain Total: $ 522,802 |Drilling Mud: $ 16,983
6:00 20:00 14:00 JLAY DOWN DRILL PIPE AND BHA ( SURVEY 3.4°) Misc. / Labor: $ -
20:00 20:30 0:30 REMOVE WEAR BUSHING Csg. Crew: $ -
20:30 21:00 0:30 PRE JOB SAFETY MEETING Welding: $ -
21:00 0:00 3:00 RU CALIPER CASING CREW Shaker Screens: $ -
0:00 6:00 6:00 RUN 5% 23# P-110 LT&C TO 5300'
|Daily Totai: $ 43,158
BHA
g T g, e g e g
cueiveD
SN 2-4 2008
D7 OiL, GAS & MINING
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981° 0
Wasatch 3681' 0 Kenilworth 11261" 0
|Mesaverde 7831° 0 Aberdeen 11461° [
Lower Measverc 9611" o Spring canyon 2?2 0
Castlegate 10442 0 Mancos 11536" 0 TOTAL BHA = 0.00
Desert 10661 0 Dakota 16141 0 Survey
24.00 |Grassy 10841 0 D 16610 0 Survey 3.4 16610'
P/U FLARE DRLG: N/A Deg OFF BKG GAS 0
S/0 FLARE TRIP: N/A Gas Buster: OFF CONN GAS 0
ROT. LAST CSG.RA 9 5/8 SET @ 4999' KB PEAK GAS 0
FUEL Used: 1050 On Hand: 5,700 Co.Man  Scott Alired TRIP GAS 0
BIT# 24RR ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G 0oDC RP

[ CONDITION
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G ASC Gasco Energy G-ArE CYa Si
b DAILY DRILLING REPORT TIGHT HOLE

/ AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
RKB 25'
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth  16500" | Prog.Depth 16610° l DATE 6/25/08 | DAYS: 95
Current: Operations: CEMENT PROD CASING
Depth: 16610’ IProgress 0 IDrIg Hrs: 0 IAV ROP: #DIV/0! lFormation: Dakota
|pmcC: $6,046 |TMC: $670,494 TDC: $145,356 |cwC: $5,504,841
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
fvw: 14.1 [#1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBit # Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: 87 |lsPMm: 107 Size: Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 41/38 142 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: Int. Csg: $ - |pay work $ 19,500
Gel: 20/33/41|spm: {vFG: Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,960
WL: 9.2 |cPM: 373 SIN: Float Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 Press: 2910 Jets: Well Head: $ - {water: $ -
PH : 8.5 lavoe: 463 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet $ -
PHMf: 4/5.9 Javop: 124 Depth In: Packers: $ - |MudLogger: $ -
Isolids: 24.7 Juetvel: 99 FT1G: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
Ca : 40 lEcp: 14.3 Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ 114,500
MET 7.5 [IsPR#1: FPH: Heater: $ - |pits: $ -
Chior: 4000 ISPR #2: WOB: Pumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 55 IBtm.Up min: 81 MIN R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T.  |M-RPM: jmisc: cmT $ - _|consuttant: $ 1,350
sTART | END TIME 5795 | Total Rot. Hrs: 7715 lbaytoa: s - |oritling Mua: $ 6,046
6:00 11:30 5:30 RUN 5% P-110 CASING 23# Misc. / Labor: $ -
11:30 15:00 3:30 TRY TO CIRC. THRU HCR VALVE, HCR VALVE NOT WORKING AT ALL BREAK DOWN(Csg. Crew: $ -
15:00 FORMATION LOST 165 BBLS Welding: $ -
15:00 21:00 6:00 RUN CASING Shaker Screens: $ -
21:00 23:00 2:00 CIRC. AND COND HOLE FOR CEMENT/ RD CASING CREW
23:00 1:30 2:30 TRIED TO LAY DOWN 2 JTS. OF CASING (ONLY LAYED DOWN ONE JT. LAND CASING W SLIPS @ 16603)
1:30 4:00 2:30 R/D CAING CREW AGAIN AND R/U SCHLUMBERGER TO CEMENT WELL |Daily Total: $ 145,356
4:00 6:00 2:00 PUMP 20 BBL CW100, 785 SKS G+ ADDS LEAD ( YIELD = 2.22 H20= 10.82 GL/SK
6:00 o] 12.5 PPG.) 1360 SKA 50/50 POZ G+ ADDS TAIL ( YIELD= 1.53 H20 7.026 GL/SK
0:00 14.1 PPG.) 2nd TAIL 410 Sk
0:00 DISPLACE CEMENT W KCL WATER 350BBL CEMENT BACK TO SURFACE 120 BBLS BHA
0:00
RECENED
LELE =R "~ A BB =) S
JUN-25.2008
DIV-OF-Oll- GAS-SMINING
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 (4 Sunnyside 10981" 0
Wasatch 3681° 0 Kenilworth 11261° [/}
|Mesaverde 7831" 0 Aberdeen 11461 0
Lower Measverc 9611° [ Spring canyon ?2?? 0
Castlegate 10442 0 Mancos 11536 0 TOTAL BHA = 0.00
Desert 10661° 0 Dakota 16141 0 Survey
24.00 |Grassy 10841° 0 D 16610" 0 Survey 3.4 16610'
PIU FLARE DRLG: N/A Deg : OFF BKG GAS 0
SIo FLARE TRIP: N/A Gas Buster: OFF CONN GAS 0
IROT. LAST CSG.RA 5% SET@ 16603' KB PEAK GAS 0
IFUEL Used: 1050 On Hand: 5,700 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS 0
BIT # 0 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

[ CONDITION
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RKB 25' AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 PermitDepth 16500° | Prog.Depth 16610’ DATE 6/26/08 DAYS: 96
Current: Operations: RIG DOWN FLOOR GET READY TO MOVE
[Depth:  16610" [Progress 0 |orig Hrs: 0 |av rOP: #DIV/O!  JFormation: Dakota
|omc: $0 ITMC: $687,477 TDC: $76,891 |CWC: $5,436,376
Contractor: Nabor 169 IMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Jmw: #1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 lan #: C $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
vis: SPM: 107 size: Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: #2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: Int. Csg: $ - |pay work $ 15,600
Gel: SPM: JMFG: Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ -
wi: GPM : Ism: Float Equp: $ - | $ -
Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
PH : AV DC: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ -
PAIME: AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ -
Solids: JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
Ca : Jeco: Hrs: Separator: $ - |cement: $ -
jmMBT ISPR #: FPH: Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
Chior: ISPR #2: wos: Pumping LIT: $ - Imud $ -
Dapp ppb: IBtm.Up min: 81 MIN R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: |misc: cmT $ - IConsultant: $ 1,350
START | END TIME 5795 | Total Rot. Hrs: b TT15 . |paily Total: $ - |pritiing Mud: $ -
6:00 11:00 5:00 FINISH CEMENT JOB Misc. / Labor: $ 10,000
11:00 15:30 4:30 NIPPLE DOWN AND SET SLIPS W/ 30,000# OVER STRING WT. Csg. Crew: $ 49941
15:30 18:00 2:30 SET BOP BACK DOWN AND RIG DOWN ALL LINES Welding: $ -
18:00 0:00 6:00 CLEAN MUD TANKS Ishaker Screens: $ -
0:00 6:00 6:00 JR/U FLOOR
6:00
0:00 |Daily Total: $ 76,891
0:00
0:00 o)
0:00
0:00 BHA
0:00
RECERED
LN 7 5 9008
TV S & BT o
DIV-OF Ot GASEIINING
Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981° 0
Wi h 3681° 0 Kenilworth 11261 0
|Mesaverde 7831° 0 Aberdeen 11461° 0
Lower Measverc 9611° (3 Spring canyon ?2? 0
Castlegat 10442 O Mancos 11536" 0 TOTAL BHA = 0.00
|Desert 10661° 0 Dakota 16141" [ Survey
24.00 IGrassy 10841° 0 D 16610° 0 Survey 3.4 16610"
IPIU FLARE DRLG: N/A Deg OFF BKG GAS 0
S$/I0 FLARE TRIP: N/A Gas Buster: OFF CONN GAS 0
IROT. LAST CSG.RA 5% SET @ 16603' KB PEAK GAS 0
FUEL Used: 1050  On Hand: 5,700 Co.Man  Scott Allred TRIP GAS 0
BIT # 0 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

| CONDITION




TS KisE S-/
L2~ 0lz— 3485

if‘ Gpre CY, '
GE_fl_\%I—%% DAILY DRILLING REPORT TlGVﬁT H%f.fE

AFE # 40104 GPS = 39.855139, -110.240942
RKB 25'
Well: GCS 23-16-11-15 Permit Depth 16500" | Prog.Depth 16610’ DATE 6/26/08 DAYS: 97
Current: Operations: FINAL REPORT
|pepth:  16610° IProgress 0 IDrlg Hrs: 0 IAV ROP: #DIV/O! IFormatlon: D
lome: $0 [tmc: $687,477 TDC: $16,950 |cwe: $5,376,435
Contractor: Nabor 169 lMud Co: ADVANTAGE TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
[aw: #1 NATIONAL 10-P-130 IBlt #: c $ - |Loccost: $ -
vis: Ispm: 107 ISIze: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: #2 NATIONAL 10-P-130 Type: Int. Csg: $ - {pay work $ 15,600
Gel: SPM: {MFG: Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ -
WL GPM : ISIN: Float Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
PH : AV DC: TD Qut: TBG/Rods: $ = |Fuet: $ -
Pf/MF: AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -
|sotids: JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
Ca : JEcD: Hrs: ISeparator: $ - |cement: $ -
MBT ]SPR #1: FPH: Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
Chior: SPR#2 : WOB: P uT: $ - |Mud $ -
Dapp ppb: |Btm.Up min: 81 MIN  |rR-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - |camp $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T.  |M-RPM: [Misc: cMT $ - |Consultant: $ 1,350
START | END TIME 5795 | Total Rot. Hrs: 774577 |paily Totar $ - |priting Mud: $ -
6:00 18:00 12:00 RIG DOWN TOP DRIVE, KOOMEY, LOAD OUT DRILL PIPE START TO MOVE Misc. / Labor: $ -
18:00 TO THE SWF 41-26-9-18 Csg. Crew: $ -
0:00 Welding: $ -
0:00 Shaker Screens: $ -
0:00
0:00
0:00 Daily Total: $ 16,950
0:00
0:00 0
0:00
0:00 BHA
= RECEIVED
JUN Z b Zuu8
Div. GF Gil, GAS & MINING
Depth Feet To Go _Depth Feet To Go
Green River 25 0 Sunnyside 10981" 0
h 3681° 0 Kenilworth 112610 O
Mesaverde 7831° 0 Aberdeen 11461° 0
Lower Measverc 9611° [ Spring canyon ??? 0
Castlegate 10442 0O Mancos 11536' 0’ TOTAL BHA = 0.00
Desert 10661 0 Dakota 16141 0 Survey
24.00 |Grassy 10841° 0 D 16610 0 Survey 3.4 16610’
| (1Y) FLARE DRLG: N/A Degasser: OFF BKG GAS 0
S/I0 FLARE TRIP: N/A Gas Buster: OFF CONN GAS 0
IROT. LAST CSG.RA 5% 23# P-110 SET @ 16603' KB PEAK GAS 0
IEQE‘L Used: 1050  On Hand: 5,700 Co.Man  Scott Alired TRIP GAS 0
BIT # 0 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

[ conbiTioN




. - CONFIDENTIAL

‘ STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
ML-47067
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS NA
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, sigriificantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to NA

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

owwel [ caswell /] oTHER Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 4301332685
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR; PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

8 INVERNESS DRIVE E,STE .., ENGLEWOOD CO ..80112 (303) 483-0044 Wildcat

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT sURFACE: 1895' FSL & 2007' FWL county: UINTAH
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NESW 16 118 15E STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION : TYPE OF ACTION

[ acioize {] oeeren

NOTICE OF INTENT REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

{Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING m FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: CASING REPAIR D NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON
8/1 9/2008 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR
CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE
[] suBSEQUENT REPORT WATER DISPOSAL

{Submit Originat Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion:

Dooooodao

]
O
CHANGE WELL NAME ] puseack
O]
L]

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE

OTHER:

ONOooodd

[

CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12.  DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco intends to complete all productive intervals in the Morrison, Dakota and Mancos formations and to commingle production from these intervals.
Following final fracture stimulation treatments a Completion Report will be submitted.

No new surface disturbance is anticipated. If any is necessary, prior approval will be obtained.

If required, the method used to account for and to allocate production from each pool so commingled will be by individual interval hydrocarbon pore volume
calculation.

Gasco Production Company is the owner of all contiguous oil and gas leases or drilling units overlying the pools, and does herewith waive it's right to the
15-day period of objection per UDOGM Rule 649-3-22(3). Gasco respectfully requests that the Division therefore accept this NOI in lieu of the required
affidavit with regard to notification of the aforementioned owners.

Attachment: Exhibit showing the location of all well on contiguous oif and gas leases or drilling units overlying the subject pools.

COPY SENT TO OPERATOR

Date: 7-25-2008'

Initiales___ 2

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) .Majg/;;gw/ewe'ﬁé} mme Petroleum Engineer

SIGNATUR — DATE _ 3/ / g/ 6(003

1y e
{This space for State use only) ! APPR O O F

| D\V\SlON
- T OF UTAH DIVISIO

RECFEIVED
0|L G zz ‘

JUL 10 2008
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

{5/2000) BY .
.
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GATE CANYON STATE
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Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15 (JASC()

Sec 16-T11S-R15E
Duchesne Co, Utah Energy




STATE OF UTAH i
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESQURCES

FORM 9

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

ML-47067

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

NA

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Gate Canyon

1. TYPE OF WELL
oiLweLL [] GAS WELL /] OTHER

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
Gasco Production Company

9. APl NUMBER;:

4301332685

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER:
8 Inverness DrE, Ste 100 ..., Englewood eizre GO 5, 80112 (303) 483-0044

10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
Gate Canyon

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 1895' FSL & 2007' FWL

county: Duchesne

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NESW 16 11S  15E STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[] acioize [] oeepen [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
I:I NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) [] actErcasing [] rFrACTURE TREAT [] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [] casiNG rRePAIR [] newconsTRucTION [[] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[] cHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [[] orEraTOR cHANGE [] TusiNGREPAIR
[[] cHance TuBING [] Pruc Anp ABANDON [] veNTORFLARE
/] suBsEQUENTREPORT [[] cHancE weLL NAME [] Pwesack [] water DIsPOsAL
{Submit Original Form Only)
[[] cHancE weLL sTATUS [[] erODUCTION (START/RESUME) [] waTeR sHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:
[[] commiNGLE PRODUGING FORMATIONS [] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE /] omHer: Well status update
] convert weLL TvPE [[] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

This well has been drilled and is currently awaiting completion. We expect to start completion procedures by October 1st, 2008.

NavE pLease pr,_Beverly Walker nme Engineering Tech
SIGNATURE \é}\wi RIS i L \} [ [ e 9/4/2008
(This space for State use only)
RECEIVED
- e o s SEP 08 2008

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



CONFIDENTIAL

GASCO Production Company

Lease: Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15
Legal: NE SW of Sec 16-T11S-R15E
Duchesne County, UT
API: 43-013-32685

TOC inside surface csg.
06/27/08 Final Drilling Report
(PME) DC $111,086 CC $6,258,778
06/30/08 Dispose of Reserve Pit water
(PME) DC $11,661 CC $6,270,439
07/15/08 Set tanks (@ start battery construction.
(PME) DC $26,745 CC $6,297,184
Completion
9/11/08 When csg was landed and csg head installed it was not installed straight.

MIRU Weatherford csg jacks. Pull 200,000#’s on csg. WHI cut csg head
and 5 %” csg off. Reinstall 9 5/8” csg head and set 5 }2” in slips. Install
tbg head. SDFD. (JD)

Page 1 of 1
Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15



)8) Garol Daniels - Gate Canyon otate 23-16-11-15 Gompletion Report - Gorrection ' Page 11

From: "Reports" <reports@gascoenergy.com>
To: <caroldaniels@utah.gov>, <Matt_Baker@blm.gov>, "Beverly Walker" <bwalker...
Date: 9/11/2008 10:08 AM
Subject: Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15 Completion Report - Correction
Attachments: Gate Canyon Completion reports.doc

<<Gate Canyon Completion reports.doc>>

Bev Walker /Jessica Berg

Gasco Production Co

303-483-0044

This well is tight hole and ALL information is to be held confidential.
The information transmitted within this e-mail is intended only for the
person or entity to which it is addressed and contains confidential
information. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of,
or taking of any action in reliance upon, this information by persons or
entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you

received this in error, please contact the sender and delete the
material from any computers.

RECEIVED
SEP 112008

Mg e S Tap MIBING



“ STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES ‘
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

ML-47067

P A

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS NA

: 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter piugged wells, or to G t C
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. ate Lanyon
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER
L ] Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Gasco Production Company 4301332685
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL., OR WILDCAT:

8 Inverness DrE, Ste 100 ... Englewood srare OO 5280112 (303) 483-0044 Gate Canyon

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH
11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT ] Ol O
(Submit in Duplicate) [ AutER CASING [] FRACTURE TREAT [[] sioETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work wilt start: [T] casinG RepaR [J newconsTRUCTION [T] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[] cHanee To PREVIOUS PLANS [[] orERATOR CHANGE [[] tueine RePaR
[] cHanGE TUBING [C] PLUG AND ABANDON [T] venTORFLARE
[] suBseQuENT REPORT [] cHANGE WELL NAME [ puesack (] warer DisPOsSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[] cHANGE WELL STATUS [] probucTiON (START/IRESUME) [T] WATER sHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:
[[] commiNGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE ] omher: Keep records
[] CONVERT WELL TYPE [] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION confidential

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco Production Company will be moving a rig onto this location to start drilling within the next few weeks we respectfully
request that you keep all records confidential for as long of a period as possible.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) }éveriy Walker mme Engineering Technician

SIGNATURE {V é:// ” 4 ///é/ ./Z // /Z{ oare 3/5/2008
{This space for State use only) | ‘ , HECEF VED

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) D’V OF 0”_, GAS & M’N’NG



- CONFIDENTIAL

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
. ML-47067
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS S'N'j\'”““*”' ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAVE:

. 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing weils below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to G t C
arill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. ate Lanyon

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

oLwell [1  casweLL [/]  OTHER Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Gasco Production Company ‘ 4301332685
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

8 Inverness Dr E, Ste 100 Englewood

= CO  ,,,80112 (303) 483-0044 Gate Canyon

[N

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 1895 FSL& 2007' FWL

county: ‘Duchesne =~ =

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NESW. 16~ 41 S 15E STATE:
’ ' s UTAH
M. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[] acioize [] opeeren [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
_@\ NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) [] ALTERCASWNG [] FRACTURE TREAT [[] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start; [] casNGREPAR [[] ~ewconsTRUCTION [[] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[] cHanee 10 PREVIOUS PLANS [J orerator crance [] TueiNGREPAIR
[] chanGE TUBING [] Puc AN ABANDON [] vENTORFLARE
SUBSEQUENT REPORT [] cHanGE WELL NAME [(] rweeack [T] waTER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[[] cHANGE wELL sTATUS |___| PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [] WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:
[} commINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS || RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE V1 orher: Well status update
[] converTweLL TveE [C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

This well has been drilled and is currently awaiting completion. Due to the unavailability of frac sand, the soonest we expect to
start completion procedures is mid November.

name (PLEASE PRNT)ZDEVerly Walker mme _Engineering Tech
SIGNATURE (/ yZ, %L/Z,/ £ 7, /’//4 2’_/\ oare 10/2/2008
/_ L
(This space for State use only)
RECEIVED
0CT 67 2
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side}

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MiNING



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
ML-47067
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS “'N'Z"”"‘"' ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to NA
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL farm for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
owel [0 caswe ] omHer Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APINUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 4301332685
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POGL, OR WILDCAT:
8 INVERNESS DRIVE E,STE ., ENGLEWOOD sare CO 80112 (303) 483-0044 Wildcat
4. LOGATION OF WELL .
FOOTAGES AT sSURFACE: 1895' FSL & 2007' FWL county: UINTAH
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERDIAN: NESW 16 11S 15E STATE:
UTAH
. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION _ _ TYPE OF ACTION
7] NoOTICEOF! [ acioeze ] oeepen [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit In Duplicate) [ auercasine [/] FracTURE TREAT [J sioeTrACK TO REPAR WELL
Approximate date work will start [ casinerePar [ wewconstRucTION [[] TemroraRILY ABANDON
11/5/2008 [] cnanae TOPREVIOUS PLANS [] oreraToR cHANGE [ rusiererar
] craneeTUBING [] FLuc anp asanpon [[] ventorrare
[0 sussequent ReporT [J cHanee weLL NaME [J rweeack [] water DisposaL
{Submit Original Form Only)
] cnanee wew sTATUS [C] erobucTioN (START/RESUME) [} water sHuT-OFF
Date of work completion:
[Z] commNgLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE O omer:
[0 converTweLL TvPE [} RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent detalls including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco intends to complete all productive intervals in the Morrison, Dakota, Mancos and Mesaverde formations and to commingle production from these
intervals. Following final fracture stimulation treatments a Completion Report will be submitted.

No new surface disturbance is anticipated. If any is necessary, prior approval will be obtained.

If required, the method used to account for and to allocate production from each pool so commingled will be by individual interval hydrocarbon pore volume
calculation.

Gasco Production Company is the owner of alt contiguous oil and gas leases or drilling units overlying the pools, and does herewith waive it's right to the
15-day period of objection per UDOGM Rule 649-3-22(3). Gasco respectfully requests that the Division therefore accept this NO1 in lieu of the required
affidavit with regard to notification of the aforementioned owners.

Attachment: Exhibit showing the location of all well on contiguous oil and gas leases or drilling units overlying the subject pools.
COPY SENT TO OPERATOR

oute: /L1 2 2008
Initials: [£5

NavE (PLEase privny_MahEw- Owens™ mme Petroleum Engineer
/31 [o8

SIGNATURE DATE

Iy

(This space for Stats uss only) APPROVED BY THE STATE _
OF UTAH DIVISION OF RECEIVED
OlL, GAS AE?B%’HE\NNG
DATE: \FZ“{ e(l NOY 0 4 2008
. BY: e [M,' g Div. OF OIL, GAS & MINIG

v
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Gasco Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15

NESW 16-T11S-R15E
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES T )
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
ML-47067
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A
. 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly despen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to G ate C anvon
drill horizontal Jaterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. y
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
o weLL [] GASWELL Il OTHER Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APl NUMBER:
Gasco Production Company 013-32685
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
14 Iverness Dr. Suite #H236 .. Englewood sz CO 580112 (303) 483-0044 Gate Canyon
4. LOCATION OF WELL
rooTaces AT surFacE: 1895' FSL and 2007' FWL county: Duchesne
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NESW 16 11 15 STATE:
: UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION .
D NOTICE OF INTENT |:| ACIDIZE [:] DEEPEN [:| REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit in Duplicate) |___| ALTER CASING D FRACTURE TREAT [:| SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: D CASING REPAIR D NEW CONSTRUCTION E] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
|:] CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D OPERATOR CHANGE |:| TUBING REPAIR
[[] cHance TuBING [T PLuc AND ABANDON [] venToRFLARE
[ZI SUBSEQUENT REPORT E] CHANGE WELL NAME D PLUG BACK [:, WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Originai Form Only)
5 | [[] cHanGE wWELL STATUS [J PrODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) [[] waTER sHUT-OFF
ate of work completion:
[[] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE otHer: Repairs
11/5/2008 [:] CONVERT WELL TYPE ['_—_] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

History: 5 1/2" casing string had slips improperly set by the well head service companies. Was elected to cut off 5 5/8" and 5
1/2" Casing. Installed slip-collars and welded on 9 5/8" and 5 1/2" to bring up to grade. Reinstalled wellhead and set 5 1/2" to
install tubing head.

-During completion of Morrison and Dakota: 5 1/2" casing and wellhead was tested to 12,500 psi and frac stages 1 and 2 were
pumped without incident. These zones were flowed back for several days until the pressure reached 0 psi on the larger choke
and 5 to 8 bbls of water/hr. While breaking down Upper Dakota for fracture, pressure reached 10,800 psi and upper welds on
slip collars failed on the 9 5/8" and 5 1/2" resulting in the wellhead, tubing head and frac assembly to blow off. The well blew
down to 0 psi in less than 1 minute. A vacuum truck removed all water from out of the area around the well and the well began
flowing approximately 5 bbl./hr. No Gas was observed at the surface.

11/3/08 & 11/4/08- Solution as witnessed by Dennis Ingram (UDOGM Roosevelt):
-15' of cement was placed on top of a 10K high temperature, composite plug at 10,000'.
-Secondary 10K containment plug was set at 5,000

11/5/08- Currently consulting with Boots and Coots Well Control Specialists on the reconstruction and installation of 9 /58"
wellhead, slips and tubing head.

NAME (PLEASE prInT)_ShON Scott McKinnon e Regulatory Specialist
e -
SIGNATURE Mqﬂ%m pare _11/5/2008

{This space for State use only)

RECEIVED -
NOV 17 20 ¢
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING.

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)



GASCO Production Company

Lease: Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15 SR
Legal: NE SW of Sec 16-T11S-R15E o
Duchesne County, UT
API: 43-013-32685

TOC inside surface csg.

06/27/08

06/30/08

07/15/08

7/31/08

Completion

9/10/08

9/11/08

9/30/08

10/10/08

10/21/08

10/29/08

Final Drilling Report
(PME) DC §111,086 CC $6,258,778

Dispose of Reserve Pit water
(PME) DC $11,661 CC $6,270,439

Set tanks @) start battery construction.
(PME) DC $26,745 CC $6,297,184

Late costs: Cover pit, set tanks, build tank battery
(PME) DC $71,977 CC $6,369,161

Complete tank battery (PME) DC $20,096 CC $6,422,333

When csg was landed and csg head installed it was not installed straight.
MIRU Weatherford csg jacks. Pull 200,000#’s on csg. WHI cut csg head
and 5 72" csg off. Reinstall 9 5/8” csg head and set 5 '2” in slips. Install
tbg head. SDFD. (JD)

KCL, Frac water, Tanks hauled, Tank Rent
(PME) DC $135,777 CC $6,558,110

Disposal of Water, Insulation for tank battery
(PME) DC $31,380 CC $6,589,490

Wire for computer hook up, correction for pit on 7/31/08
(PME) DC $-16,045 CC $6,573,445

RU Superior ws to frac. Psi test csg to 12,300 psi, watch for 5 min. test
good. RU RIH w/3 1/8” scalloped guns 3spf 120 degree phasing. Tag @
16,477’. Decision as per (JDL, Mike logan XTO) to move bottom set of
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10/30/08

10/31/08

11/1/08

11/2/08

11/3/08

11/4/08

perfs to 16,446-50°. Perf stage-1 Morrison {/16,446-60°, 16,450-54°.
POOH. RU to frac. Bleed well off to 2,000 psi. Well did not build any psi.
Bleed well off to 200 psi, well built to 217 psi. Break dn perfs w/10,984 @
3.5 bpm. Hybrid frac well w/5,000# 100 mesh, 70,000# 18/40 Versa prop
sand, 1,518 bbls 30# XL-BHT gel, and flushed w/344 bbls 10# linear
gel/fresh water. SD. ISIP 9,593 FG 1.021. 5 min SI 9,049. Average rate
35 bpm, average psi 10,700. Job pumped very well. Turn well over to fb
@ 4:40 p.m. w/9,900 on a 8/64 ck. SDFD. (JDL, SCE, JD, MO)

(PME) DC $128,098 CC $6,701,534

7:00 a.m. 700 on a 10/64 ck. Made 952 bbls in 14 hrs 20 min, TR 952 bbls
BLWTR 910 bbls. RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP @@
16.256°, well psi built to 4,200. Perf stage-2 Dakota 1/16,224-34°. POOH.
RU to frac. Break dn perfs w/9,499 @ 5.2 bpm. Hybrid frac well w/5,000#
100 mesh, 85,000# 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,648 bbls 30# XL-BHT gel,
and flushed w/341 bbls 10# linear gel/fresh water. SD. ISIP 9,940 FG
1.06. Average rate 35 bpm, average psi 11,250. Job pumped very well.
Watch well for 30 min. 5 min SI 9,272, 10 min SI 9,000, 15 min SI 8,924,
20 min SI 8,878, 25 min SI 8,848, 30 min SI SI 8,818. Open well up to fb
@ 12:51 p.m. w/8,800 on an 8/64 ck. SDFD. (JD, JDL, MO)

(PME) DC $ 137,658 CC $6,839,201

SWI @ 10:00 p.m. (10/29/08) w/900 on a 12/64 ck. Made 636 bbls in 9
hrs 35 min, TR 1,641 bbls, BLWTR 2,210 bbis. RU RIH w/plug and guns.
Tag @ 16,033°. Top perf stage-2 16,112° 79’ to high. POOH. Open well
up to fb and well psi fell to 100 psi in 15 min. Decision was made to bring
in coil tbg to wash out well. RDMO stinger+JW wireline+frac equipment
needed. Open well up to tb w/5,500 on a 8/64 ck. SDFD. (JD)

7:00 200 on a 8/64 ck. Made 250 bbls, TR 1,891 bbls, BLWTR 1,960 bbls.

7:00 am. 200 on a 8/64 ck. Made 152 bbls in 24 hrs, TR 2,043 bbls,
BLWTR 1,808 bbls.

7:00 am. 200 on a 8/64 ck. Made 76 bbls in 24 hrs, TR 2,119 bbls,
BLWTR 1,732 bbls. RU CTS coil tbg. RIH w/2 7/8 wash nozzle. Tag sand
@ 16,033” wash dn to plug @ 16,256°. Circ and POOH. Saw lot of sand in
returns. SWIL. SDFD. JD) DC 3566 CC 6,842,767

RU Stinger+JW wireline. RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP
@ 16,170 Perfs stage-3 Dakota £/16,112-22 POOH. RU to frac. Break
dn perfs w/9,894 @ 3 bpm. during pre pad @ 10,800 w/38 bpm the well
head blew apart. 0 injuries occurred. The slip collar that was welded to
the 5 72" csg pulled apart and well head came off @ the tbg head. RIH
w/10k Magnum Bridge plug, Set plug @ 10,000° POOH. RIH w/dump
bailer and set 10’ cement on top of plug. POOH. When OOH the glass in
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11/5/08

11/6/08

11/7/08

11/8/08

11/12/08

11/13/08

11/14/08

11/15/08

bailer did not break. Reload bailer and RIH. Set 10° of cement on top of
plug. POOH. RIH w/10k Magnum bridge plug, set plug @ 5,000’. POOH.
SDFD. (JD)

(PME) DC $40,928 CC $6,883,695

No work on well today. Meet w/ Boots & Coots (Richard Hatteberg, John
Reece) @ well sight to determine how to fix well head. (JD)

RDMO Superior frac equipment, Stinger, JW wireline. Dig out around
well head to expose 13 5/8” conductor pipe. Will have WHI on location in
the a.m. to repair well head. (JD)

No work on well today. Waiting on wellhead parts. (JD)

WHI on location. Dig down around 13 5/8” csg and cut off. Cut slip collar
off 9 5/8” csg. Re-weld csg head on 9 5/8”. Install tbg head and set self
energizing slips around 5 '2” csg. Psi test seals on 9 5/8” to 2,400 psi. test
seals on 5 % to 12,500 psi. SDFD. (JD)

MIRU CTS coil tbg. RIH w/ 4.454 Convex clear cut mill+2 7/8” ECTD
even wall motor+2 7/8” jars+disconnect+circ sub. Did not see plug #1 @
5,000’ tag up @ 6,000° drill off. Tag @ 7,000’ drill off. Tag plug # 2 @
9,980’ drill for four hours holding 4,000 back psi. had to surge dn to 1,200
several times to keep bit clean to drill. Drill up and saw 4,300 psi fcp. Psi
bled down to 200 psi in 30 min. RIH. Tag @ 14,740’ drill off saw 0 psi
inc. RIH tag plug #3 @ 16,170 Pick up for weight check. RIH plug gone.
RIH tag plug #4 @ 16,250°. Drill for 2 hrs could not make any hole.
Circulate bottoms up and SWI. POOH. RDMO CTS. SDFD. (JD)

No work on well today.

Fd SICP 4,500. RU JW wireline. RIH w/plug. Set 10k Magnum FTEP @
16,148’ POOH. RU to frac. Pump into perfs w/9,380 @ 3.2 bpm. Hybrid
frac well w/5,000# 100 mesh, 75,000# 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,549 bbls
30# XL-BHT gel, and flushed w/342 bbls 2% kcl. SD. ISIP 9,851 FG 1.05
Average rate 40 bpm, average psi 10,500. SWI. SDFD. (JD)

FD SICP 8,000. RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP @
15,950 Perf stage-4 Dakota silt £/15,839-43°, 15,869-73°, 15,912-16°.
Break dn perfs w/9,111 @ 3.3 bpm. Hybrid frac well w/5,000# 100 mesh,
65,000# 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,200 bbls XL BHT gel, and flushed
w/332 bbls 2% kcl. SD. ISIP 8,994 FG 1.01 Average rate 39 bpm, average
psi 9,500. Turn well over to tb @ 5:45 p.m. w/8,500 on a 10/64 ck. SDFD.
(JD)
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11/16/08

11/17/08

11/18/08

11/19/08

11/20/08

6:00 a.m. 900 on a 12/64 ck. Made 649 bbls in 12 hrs 15 min, TR 2,777,
BLWTR 4,497 bbls. RU CTS coil tbg. RIH w/ 4.454 convex clear cut
mill+ 2 7/8” ECTD even wall motor+disconnect+circ sub-+jars+motor
head+disconnect. Holding 1,700 back psi, tag plug #1 @ 15,945’ motor
stalled and saw 2,600 psi inc. Pick and tbg stuck. Work up/dn several
times. Pump nitrogen dn coil to lift sand. Saw heavy sand @ pit returns.
Pull to 80% of coil tbg max. Tbg still stuck. SWI for night to let equalize.
SDFD. (JD)

Fd 6,000 sicp. Pull to 80% of tbg max, tbg still stuck. Open well up to
flow back to bring psi dn. Talk w/(JDL) drop disconnect ball. Saw ball hit
tbg still stuck. Drop circ sub ball. Did not see ball hit. SWI. Tbg and well
equalized and psi came up together, indicating possible hole in tbg string.
Drop final disconnect ball. Did not see ball hit. Pull to 80% of max one
last time and tbg still stuck. Turn well over to fb until decision is made.
Open well @ 12:37 p.m. w/1,300 on a 12/64 ck. SDFD. (JD)

7:00 a.m. 1,000 on a 16/64 ck. Made 433 bbls in 18 hrs 23 min, TR 3,210
bbls, BLWTR 4,064 bbls. No work on well today, waiting on pipe
recovery tools.

7:00 am. 500 on a 20 ck. Made 389 bbls in 23 hrs, TR 3,599 bbls,
BLWTR 3,675 bbls. RU JW wireline. Shut cts BOP and set slips. Bleed
off lubricator. Disconnect lubricator, pick up under injector and cut coil
tbg. Install plug and feed coil back through injector. Set injector back on
wellhead. Pull plug and install 10k TIW valve. RIH inside coil w/free
point tools w/50,000# pulled tension @ injector. Tag @ 15,706’. Could
not see free point. Pull out of hole to 12,000#, slack off to 35,000# and
work up to 50,000# see fp. When slacked off to 35,000# could not get past
15,468’. Slack in pipe would bend pipe not allowing it to go down. Pull
tension to 50,000# RIH. Find free point @ 15,706’. POOH. RIH find
unassisted fp @ 35,000# tension. Flag pipe for cut @ 15,468°. POOH.
SDFD. (JD)

7:00 a.m. 100 on a 32 ck. Made 399 bbls in 23 hrs 11 min, TR 3,998 bbls,
BLWTR 3,276. 55% TL recovered. RIH w/gun. Perf 1 shot @ 15,468’
POOH. When perf gun shot a 4’ long 1” diameter balance bar parted from
gun and was left in the hole. Should be inside fish top. RIH w/(RTC)
radial cutting torch. Cut coil tbg off @ 15,468°. Pull to 65,000# tbg free.
POOH RTC tool. When RTC fired a 4’ long 1” diameter balance bar
parted from RTC tool and was left in the hole. Should be inside fish top.
POOH RTC tool. RDMO JW wire line. Cut 1,100’ coil tbg off reel. Attach
coil to reel and POOH coil tbg. SWI to build psi, will turn to sales when
psi builds to 1,000#’s to over come 700 psi sales line. SDFD. (JD) Leftin
hole 477’ 1 3%” coil tbg .156 wall thickness, 2.656 ppf, 70,270# pipe body
yeid,+ 2 4’ by 1”dia balance bar+2 7/8” Motor head assembly, (possibly
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11/21/08

11/22/08

11/23/08

11/24/08

11/25/08

11/26/08

disconnected)+2 7/8” dual acting jars+2 7/8” high tensile disconnect
(possibly disconnected)+2 7/8” ECTD even wall motor+4.450 Convex
clear cut mill. SDFD. (JD)

7:00 a.m. 100 on a 32/64 ck. Made 151 bbls in 18 hrs TR 4,128 bbls
BLWTR 3,146 bbls. Turn well over to sales w/1,300 on a 16/64 ck and psi
fell off in 1 hr to equal sales line. Well would no longer sale gas. Take
back to tank to try to unload water. (JD)

7:00 am 800 on a 18/64 ck. Made 21 bbls in 12 hrs 17 min TR 4,149 bbls,
BLWTR 3,125 bbls.

7:00 am. 200 on a 24/64 ck. Made 302 bbls in 24 hrs, TR 4,451 bbls,
BLWTR 2,823 bbls.

7:00 am. 200 on a 24/64 ck. Made 138 bbls in 24 hrs. TR 4,589 bbls,
BLWTR 2,689 bbls.

7:00 a.m. 200 on a 24/64 ck. Made 123 bbls in 24 hrs, TR 4,709 bbls,
BLWTR 2,565 bbls.

SWI for psi build test. Release flow back crew until 11/30/08. (JD)
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42012 - 22095

disconnected)+2 7/8”. dual acting jarst2 7/8” high tensile disconnect
(possibly disconnected)+2 7/8” ECTD even wall motor+4.450 Convex
clear cut mill. SDFD. (JD)

11/21/08 7:00 am. 100 on a 32/64 ck. Made 151 bbls in 18 hrs TR 4,128 bbls
BLWTR 3,146 bbls. Turn well over to sales w/1,300 on a 16/64 ck and psi
fell off in 1 hr to equal sales line. Well would no longer sale gas. Take
back to tank to try to unload water. (JD)

11/22/08 7:00 am 800 on a 18/64 ck. Made 21 bbls in 12 hrs 17 min TR 4,149 bbls,
BLWTR 3,125 bbls.

11/23/08 7:00 am. 200 on a 24/64 ck. Made 302 bbls in 24 hrs, TR 4,451 bbls,
BLWTR 2,823 bbls.

11/24/08 7:00 a.m. 200 on a 24/64 ck. Made 138 bbls in 24 hrs. TR 4,589 bbls,
BLWTR 2,689 bbls.

11/25/08 7:00 a.m. 200 on a 24/64 ck. Made 123 bbls in 24 hrs, TR 4,709 bbls,
BLWTR 2,565 bbls.

11/26/08 SWI for psi build test. Release flow back crew until 11/30/08. (JD)

Rig up Workover to start fishing job (for stuck coil thg)

12-03-08 100 fcp. M.ILS.U. from L.T. 14-14-9-19. (WILDCAT) Spot in all
equipment. R.U. Rig. Unload 380 jts. PH-6 TBG. onto pipe racks.
S.D.F.N. (RIG WILL BE DOWN FOR APPROX. 2 DAYS FOR
REPAIRS) DC 8150 CC 6,891,845
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* CONFIDENTHL

GASCO Production Company

Lease: Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15
Legal: NE SW of Sec 16-T11S-R15E
Duchesne County, UT
API: 43-013-32685

TOC inside surface csg.

06/27/08

06/30/08

07/15/08

7/31/08

Completion

9/10/08

9/11/08

9/30/08

10/10/08

10/21/08

10/29/08

Final Drilling Report
(PME) DC $111,086 CC $6,258,778

Dispose of Reserve Pit water
(PME) DC $11,661 CC $6,270,439

Set tanks (@ start battery construction.
(PME) DC $26,745 CC $6,297,184

Late costs: Cover pit, set tanks, build tank battery
(PME) DC $71,977 CC $6,369,161

Complete tank battery (PME) DC $20,096 CC $6,422,333

When csg was landed and csg head installed it was not installed straight.
MIRU Weatherford csg jacks. Pull 200,000#’s on csg. WHI cut csg head
and 5 %> csg off. Reinstall 9 5/8” csg head and set 5 4” in slips. Install
tbg head. SDFD. (JD)

KCL, Frac water, Tanks hauled, Tank Rent HRECEIVED
(PME) DC $135,777 CC $6,558,110 JAN 09 2009

Disposal of Water, Insulation for tank battery - ‘
(PME) DC $31,380 CC $6,589,490 DAL OF OIL, GAS & MINING

Wire for computer hook up, correction for pit on 7/31/08
(PME) DC $-16,045 CC $6,573,445

RU Superior ws to frac. Psi test csg to 12,300 psi, watch for 5 min. test
good. RU RIH w/3 1/8” scalloped guns 3spf 120 degree phasing. Tag @
16,477°. Decision as per (JDL, Mike logan XTO) to move bottom set of
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10/30/08

10/31/08

11/1/08

11/2/08

11/3/08

11/4/08

perfs to 16,446-50°. Perf stage-1 Morrison {/16,486-90°, 16,450-54°.
POOH. RU to frac. Bleed well off to 2,000 psi. Well did not build any psi.
Bleed well off to 200 psi, well built to 217 psi. Break dn perfs w/10,984 @
3.5 bpm. Hybrid frac well w/5,000# 100 mesh, 70,000# 18/40 Versa
prop sand, 1,518 bbls 30# XL-BHT gel, and flushed w/344 bbls 10#
linear gel/fresh water. SD. ISIP 9,593 FG 1.021. 5 min SI9,049. Average
rate 35 bpm, average psi 10,700. Job pumped very well. Turn well over to
b @ 4:40 p.m. w/9,900 on a 8/64 ck. SDFD. (JDL, SCE, JD, MO)

(PME) DC $128,098 CC $6,701,534

7:00 a.m. 700 on a 10/64 ck. Made 952 bbls in 14 hrs 20 min, TR 952 bbls
BLWTR 910 bbls. RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP @
16,256°, well psi built to 4,200. Perf stage-2 Dakota 1/16,224-34°. POOH.
RU to frac. Break dn perfs w/9,499 @ 5.2 bpm. Hybrid frac well
w/5,000# 100 mesh, 85,000# 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,648 bbls 30#
XL-BHT gel, and flushed w/341 bbls 10# linear gel/fresh water. SD. ISIP
9,940 FG 1.06. Average rate 35 bpm, average psi 11,250. Job pumped
very well. Watch well for 30 min. 5 min SI 9,272, 10 min SI 9,000, 15 min
SI 8,924, 20 min SI 8,878, 25 min SI 8,848, 30 min SI SI §,818. Open
well up to b @ 12:51 p.m. w/8,800 on an 8/64 ck. SDFD. (JD, JDL, MO)

(PME) DC $ 137,658 CC $6,839,201

SWI @ 10:00 p.m. (10/29/08) w/900 on a 12/64 ck. Made 636 bbls in 9
hrs 35 min, TR 1,641 bbls, BLWTR 2,210 bbls. RU RIH w/plug and guns.
Tag @ 16,033°. Top perf stage-2 16,112°, 79’ to high. POOH. Open well
up to fb and well psi fell to 100 psi in 15 min. Decision was made to bring
in coil tbg to wash out well. RDMO stinger+JW wirelinet{frac equipment
needed. Open well up to fb w/5,500 on a 8/64 ck. SDFD. (JD)

7:00 200 on a 8/64 ck. Made 250 bbls, TR 1,891 bbls, BLWTR 1,960 bbls.

7:00 a.m. 200 on a 8/64 ck. Made 152 bbls in 24 hrs, TR 2,043 bbls,
BLWTR 1,808 bbls.

7:00 a.m. 200 on a 8/64 ck. Made 76 bbls in 24 hrs, TR 2,119 bbls,
BLWTR 1,732 bbls. RU CTS coil tbg. RIH w/2 7/8 wash nozzle. Tag sand
@ 16,033” wash dn to plug @ 16,256’. Circ and POOH. Saw lot of sand in
returns. SWIL. SDFD. (JD) DC3566 CC 6,842,767

RU Stinger+JW wireline. RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP
@ 16,170° Perfs stage-3 Dakota £/16,112-22° POOH. RU to frac. Break
dn perfs w/9,894 @ 3 bpm. during pre pad @ 10,800 w/38 bpm the well
head blew apart. 0 injuries occurred. The slip collar that was welded to
the 5 %4” csg pulled apart and well head came off @ the tbg head. RIH
w/10k Magnum Bridge plug, Set plug @ 10,000 POOH. RIH w/dump
bailer and set 10’ cement on top of plug. POOH. When OOH the glass in
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11/5/08

11/6/08

11/7/08

11/8/08

11/12/08

11/13/08

11/14/08

11/15/08

bailer did not break. Reload bailer and RIH. Set 10’ of cement on top of
plug. POOH. RIH w/10k Magnum bridge plug, set plug @ 5,000’. POOH.
SDFD. (JD)

(PME) DC $40,928 CC $6,883,695

No work on well today. Meet w/ Boots & Coots (Richard Hatteberg, John
Reece) @ well site to determine how to fix well head. (JD)

RDMO Superior frac equipment, Stinger, JW wireline. Dig out around
well head to expose 13 5/8” conductor pipe. Will have WHI on location in
the a.m. to repair well head. (JD)

No work on well today. Waiting on wellhead parts. (JD)

WHI on location. Dig down around 13 5/8” csg and cut off. Cut slip collar
off 9 5/8” csg. Re-weld csg head on 9 5/8”. Install tbg head and set self
energizing slips around 5 4” csg. Psi test seals on 9 5/8” to 2,400 psi. test
seals on 5 12 to 12,500 psi. SDFD. (JD)

MIRU CTS coil tbg. RIH w/ 4.454 Convex clear cut mill+2 7/8” ECTD
even wall motor+2 7/8” jars+disconnect+circ sub. Did not see plug #1 @
5,000’ tag up @ 6,000’ drill off. Tag @ 7,000 drill off. Tag plug # 2 @
9,980’ drill for four hours holding 4,000 back psi. had to surge dn to 1,200
several times to keep bit clean to drill. Drill up and saw 4,300 psi fcp. Psi
bled down to 200 psi in 30 min. RIH. Tag @ 14,740’ drill off saw O psi
inc. RIH tag plug #3 @ 16,170’ Pick up for weight check. RIH plug gone.
RIH tag plug #4 @ 16,250°. Drill for 2 hrs could not make any hole.
Circulate bottoms up and SWI. POOH. RDMO CTS. SDFD. (JD)

No work on well today.

Fd SICP 4,500. RU JW wireline. RIH w/plug. Set 10k Magnum FTFP @
16,148’ POOH. RU to frac. Pump into perfs w/9,380 @ 3.2 bpm. Hybrid
frac well w/5,0004 100 mesh, 75,000# 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,549
bbls 30# XL-BHT gel, and flushed w/342 bbls 2% kcl. SD. ISIP 9,851
FG 1.05 Average rate 40 bpm, average psi 10,500. SWI. SDFD. (JD)

FD SICP 8,000. RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP @
15,950’ Perf stage-4 Dakota silt £/15,839-43°, 15,869-73°, 15,912-16’.
Break dn perfs w/9,111 @ 3.3 bpm. Hybrid frac well w/5,000# 100
mesh, 65,0004 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,200 bbls XL. BHT gel, and
flushed w/332 bbls 2% kcl. SD. ISIP 8,994 FG 1.01 Average rate 39 bpm,
average psi 9,500. Turn well over to fb @ 5:45 p.m. w/8,500 on a 10/64
ck. SDFD. (JD)
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11/16/08

11/17/08

11/18/08

11/19/08

11/20/08

6:00 a.m. 900 on a 12/64 ck. Made 649 bbls in 12 hrs 15 min, TR 2,777,
BLWTR 4,497 bbls. RU CTS coil tbg. RIH w/ 4.454 convex clear cut
mill+ 2 7/8” ECTD even wall motor+disconnect+circ sub-+jars+motor
head+disconnect. Holding 1,700 back psi, tag plug #1 @ 15,945’ motor
stalled and saw 2,600 psi inc. Pick and tbg stuck. Work up/dn several
times. Pump nitrogen dn coil to lift sand. Saw heavy sand @ pit returns.
Pull to 80% of coil tbg max. Tbg still stuck. SWI for night to let equalize.
SDFD. (JD)

Fd 6,000 sicp. Pull to 80% of tbg max, tbg still stuck. Open well up to
flow back to bring psi dn. Talk w/(JDL) drop disconnect ball. Saw ball hit
tbg still stuck. Drop circ sub ball. Did not see ball hit. SWI. Tbg and well
equalized and psi came up together, indicating possible hole in tbg string.
Drop final disconnect ball. Did not see ball hit. Pull to 80% of max one
last time and tbg still stuck. Turn well over to fb until decision is made.
Open well @ 12:37 p.m. w/1,300 on a 12/64 ck. SDFD. (JD)

7:00 a.m. 1,000 on a 16/64 ck. Made 433 bbls in 18 hrs 23 min, TR 3,210
bbls, BLWTR 4,064 bbls. No work on well today, waiting on pipe
recovery tools.

7:00 a.m. 500 on a 20 ck. Made 389 bbls in 23 hrs, TR 3,599 bbls,
BLWTR 3,675 bbls. RU JW wireline. Shut cts BOP and set slips. Bleed
off lubricator. Disconnect lubricator, pick up under injector and cut coil
tbg. Install plug and feed coil back through injector. Set injector back on
wellhead. Pull plug and install 10k TIW valve. RIH inside coil w/free
point tools w/50,000# pulled tension @ injector. Tag @ 15,706°. Could
not see free point. Pull out of hole to 12,000#, slack off to 35,000# and
work up to 50,000# see fp. When slacked off to 35,000# could not get past
15,468’ Slack in pipe would bend pipe not allowing it to go down. Pull
tension to 50,000# RIH. Find free point @ 15,706’. POOH. RIH find
unassisted fp @ 35,000# tension. Flag pipe for cut @ 15,468’. POOH.
SDFD. (JD)

7:00 a.m. 100 on a 32 ck. Made 399 bbls in 23 hrs 11 min, TR 3,998 bbls,
BLWTR 3,276. 55% TL recovered. RIH w/gun. Perf 1 shot @ 15,468’
POOH. When perf gun shot a 4’ long 1” diameter balance bar parted from
gun and was left in the hole. Should be inside fish top. RIH w/(RTC)
radial cutting torch. Cut coil tbg off @ 15,468’. Pull to 65,000#. Tbg
finished parting, now free. POOH RTC tool. When RTC fired a 4’ long 17
diameter balance bar parted from RTC tool and was left in the hole.
Should be inside fish top. POOH RTC tool. RDMO JW wire line. Cut
1,100° coil tbg off reel. Attach coil to reel and POOH coil tbg. SWI to
build psi, will turn to sales when psi builds to 1,000#’s to over come 700
psi sales line. SDFD. (JD) Left in hole 477" 1 %” coil tbg .156 wall
thickness, 2.656 ppf, 70,270# pipe body yield,+ 2 4’ by 1”dia balance
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11/21/08

11/22/08

11/23/08

11/24/08

11/25/08

11/26/08

bar+2 7/8” Motor head assembly, (possibly disconnected)+2 7/8” dual
acting jarst+2 7/8” high tensile disconnect (possibly disconnected)+2 7/8”
ECTD even wall motor+4.450 Convex clear cut mill. SDFD. (JD)

7:00 a.m. 100 on a 32/64 ck. Made 151 bbls in 18 hrs TR 4,128 bbls
BLWTR 3,146 bbls. Turn well over to sales w/1,300 on a 16/64 ck and psi
fell off in 1 hr to equal sales line. Well would no longer sale gas. Take
back to tank to try to unload water. (JD)

7:00 am 800 on a 18/64 ck. Made 21 bbls in 12 hrs 17 min TR 4,149 bbls,
BLWTR 3,125 bbls.

7:00 a.m. 200 on a 24/64 ck. Made 302 bbls in 24 hrs, TR 4,451 bbls,
BLWTR 2,823 bbls.

7:00 a.m. 200 on a 24/64 ck. Made 138 bbls in 24 hrs. TR 4,589 bbls,
BLWTR 2,689 bbls.

7:00 a.m. 200 on a 24/64 ck. Made 123 bbls in 24 hrs, TR 4,709 bbls,
BLWTR 2,565 bbls.

SWI for psi build test. Release flow back crew until 11/30/08. (JD)

Rig up Workover to start fishing job (for stuck coil thg)

12-03-08

12-04-08

12-06-08

12-09-08

100 fcp. M.LS.U. from L.T. 14-14-9-19. (WILDCAT) Spot in all
equipment. R.U. Rig. Unload 380 jts. PH-6 TBG. onto pipe racks.
S.D.F.N. (RIG WILL BE DOWN FOR APPROX. 2 DAYS FOR
REPAIRS) DC 8150 CC 6,891,845

100 fcp 116 bbls in 24 hrs, TR 5,173 bbls, BLWTR 2,101 bbls. Unload
170 jts. PH-6 tbg. onto pipe racks. Rig crew still working on rig. (RICK)
DC 1070

50 fcp Made 118 bbls in 24 hrs, TR 5,289 bbls, BLWTR 1,983 bbls Pump
50 bbls. down csg. N.D. Frac tree. N.U. BOP STACK. R.U. FLOOR. R.U.
Flow line. S.D.F.N. (RICK) DC 11,080 CC $6,903,995

50 fcp. Pump 100 bbls. down csg. P.U. & R.ILH. w/ 3 % Oversocket W/ 4
% 0.D.Guide, x-over, 16 jts. tbg. (PH-6), x-over, x-over, lbs.,jars,x-over,
1-drill collar(3 %), 2- intensifiers,x-over, 30 jts. tbg. (PH-6) Well kicked.
Pump 15 bbls. down tbg. Well still flowing. Pump 80 bbls. down tbg.
R.ILH. w/ 34 jts. tbg. Well kicked. Pump 20 bbls. down tbg. R.LH. w/ 19

Page 5 of 9
Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15



12-10-08

12-11-08

12-12-08

12-13-08

12-14-08

12-15-2008

12-15-08

jts. tbg. S.D.F.N. (RICK) (TOTAL IN HOLE = 99 JTS. TBG.)
DC 15497 CC $6,919,492

50 fcp. Bleed off tbg. Pump 20 bbls down tbg. Well still trying to flow.
Pump 30 bbls. down tbg. R.LH. w/ 14 jts. tbg. Well kicked. Let tbg. flow
back to tank. Pump 50 bbls. down tbg. R.I.H. w/56 jts. tbg. Well kicked.
Let tbg unload to tank. Pump 50 bbls. down tbg. RILH. w/ 74 jts. tbg.’
Well kicked. Pump 50 bbls. down tbg. R.ILH. w/ 55 jts. tbg. Drain pump
& lines. S.D.FN. TOTAL IN HOLE = 299. (RICK) DC 10260 CC
$6,929,752

50 fcp 1400 sitp. Blow down tbg. Pump 50 bbls. down tbg. R.LH. w/ 24
jts. tbg. Tie back to single fast. Change over elevators to YT’s. Well
kicked. Pump 50 bbls. down tbg. R.LH. w/ 78 jts. tbg. Drain pump &
lines. TOTAL=411 JTS. PH-6. S.LW. & S.D.EN. (RICK) DC 16415
CC 6,946,167

2000 sicp 2000sitp. Pump 62 bbls. down tbg. Bleed csg. to flow-back
tank on 24/64 choke. R.LH. w/ 34 jts. tbg. Base beam for rig started to
sink. (SANK APPROX. 6° ON WELL HEAD SIDE) R.D.S.U. & Move
out of way. Had J & R fill in sink hole and re-level ground for base
beam. Set down drilling rig pad 8 x 40’ (twice as big as the last one) to
put rig base beam onto. S.LW. & S.D.F.N. (RICK) DC 12540 CC
6,958,707

2000 sicp 2000 sitp. R.U. S.U. Pump 65 bbls. down tbg. R.I.H. w/ 51
jts. tbg. R.U. Power swivel. Pump 200 bbls. down tbg. (caught pressure
@ 102 bbls. circ. after 194 bbls.) R.LH. w/ 2 jts. tbg. w/ swivel. Drain
pump & lines. S.IW. & S.D.F.N. TOTAL IN HOLE = 497 JTS. TBG.
(RICK) DC 14515 CC 6,973,222

1300 sicp 1000 sitp. H.U. Pump & lines. Blow down csg. to flow-back
tank. Pump 60 bbls. down tbg. R.LH. w/ 1 jt. tbg. Tagged on # 499 w/
14’ in. Swivel down 14 jts. tbg. Tag on jt. # S13. Jar on fish. Pulling up
to 50 k over string wt. Made 7  of hole in 45 min. Fish began to drag out
of hole 30- 45 k over sting wt. Swivel out 15 jts. tbg. (laying down) Drain
pump & lines.S.LW. & S.D.F.N. (RICK) DC 13915 CC 6,987,137

2000 sicp 1500 sitp. H.U. Pump & lines/ Put csg. to flow-back tank.
Bleed off tbg. to flat tank. Pump 30 bbl. down tbg. Rack-back swivel.
P.0.0.H. and SB 158 jts. tbg. (Rig tied back single line, very slow)(Put on
hyt elevators) Drain pump & lines. S.D.F.N. (RICK) DC 13970
CC $7,001,107

Updated costs for Fracs: (PME) $885,667 $7,886,774
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12-16-08

12-17-08

12-18-08

12-19-08

12/20/08

12/21/08

12/22/08

12/23/08

50 fcp 1100 sitp. H.U. Pump & lines. Pump 30 bbls. down tbg.
P.0O.O.H. w/ 202 jts. tbg. Tie rig back to double fast. Well kicked. Pump
20 bbls. down tbg. P.0.0.H. w/ 80 jts. tbg. Well kicked. Pump 15 bbls.
down tbg. P.O.O.H. w/ 2 jts. tbg. Well kicked. Pump 70 bbls. down tbg.
P.O.0.H. w/ 40 jts. tbg., 2-intensifiers, 1- drill collar, jars, bumper sub, 2-
x-overs, 16 jts. tbg. Found fish in oversocket. Lay down 1 jt. thg. Well
kicked. S.I. tbg. Close pipe rams & pull upset up to rams. Leave csg.
flowing to flow-back tank for night. Drain pump & lines. S.D.F.N.
(RICK) DC 16240 CC 7,903,014

20 fcp. H.U. Pump & lines. Pump 80 bbls. down csg. (leave pump
trickling) P.O.O.H. w/ 420’ of 1 %”coil tbg. Oversocket slipped and
crushed entire fish, and caught the last 12 of fish to POOH. Leave csg. to
flow-back tank. S.D.F.N. (RICK) DC 13510 CC 7,916,524

20 fcp. H.U. Pump & lines/ Pump 97 bbls. down csg. R.IH. w/ 4 74
shoe, bushing,2-jts. wash-pipe,top sub,x-over,b.s. jar,x-over,collar,2-
intensifiers, 66 jts. thg.,Well kicked. Pump 15 bbls.down tbg. R.L.LH. w/ 18
jts. tbg. Well kicked. Pump 10 bbls. down tbg. R.IL.H. w/ 110 jts. tbg.
Well kicked. Pump 10 bbls. down tbg. R.ILH. w/ 86 jts. tbg. (total in hole
=280 jts. tbg.) Leave csg. open to flow-back tank. Drain pump & lines &
S.D.F.N. (RICK) DC 8340 CC $7,924,864

100 fep 200 sitp. H.U. Pump & lines. Pump 40 bbls.down tbg. R.LH. w/
40 jts. tbg. Tie-back & change over to HYT elevators. Well kicked.

Pump 40 bbls. down tbg. R.LH. w/ 48 jts. tbg. Well kicked. Pump 30
bbls. down tbg. R.LH. w/ 130 jts. tbg. P.U. 7 jts. tbg. off racks. Leave
csg. to flow-back tank & S.D.F.N.(TOTAL IN =505 JTS. TBG.) (RICK)
DC 17902 CC $7,942,766

Fin RIH w/ last 5 jts (total 511 jts). Tagged fish 27° high. Broke (reverse)
circ, dn csg and up tbg. Washed over and started milling w/ tag jt almost
down. Milled 1 1/2° and started spinning. Not able to make any more
hole in over an hr. Start OOH w/ tbg. SB 23 stds. SDFN (SCE) DC
18107 CC $7,960,873

Unable to start mud pump. WO parts. Finally start OOH and wind blew
stds out of fingers on tbg board. POOH w/ 23 more stds. SDFN. (SCE)
DC 6870 CC $7,967,743

Cont to POOH w/ tbg. SDFN w/ total of 458 jts out. (SCE) DC 14095
CC $7,981,838

Kill tbg, POOH w/ last 53 jts tbg. LD wash pipe BHA. Found burnover
shoe with no Kut-rite left on bottom, and very little on inside. Outside of
shoe worn dn 1/16”. Found 14” of marks inside of shoe, indicating 14" of
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12-24-08

burnover. SDFN while obtaining and short catch cut lip guide for
overshot. Will start in hole in AM w/ overshot. (SCE) DC 7320 CC
$7,980,818

50 fcp. Pump 80 bbls. down csg. P.U. & R.I.LH. w/ overshot, x-over, 2 jts.
tbg., x-over, x-over, bs., jars, x-over, drill collar, x-over, 2-intensifiers, x-
over, 120 jts. tbg. Well kicked. Pump 20 bbls. down tbg. R.LH. w/ 180
jts. tbg. Tie back. Change elevators. Well kicked. Pump 20 bbls. down
tbg. R.LH. w/ 104 jts. tbg. Leave csg. to flow-back tank. S.D.F.N. (Rick)
DC 9605 CC $7,990,423

12-25 thru 12/28, SD for holidays

12-30-08

12/31/08

1-1-09

1/2/09

1-3-09

1-4-09

1-5-09

20 fep 1400 sitp. Hook up pump & lines. Pump 40 bbls. down tbg.
R.LH. w/ 2 jts. tbg. Tried to adjust brakes on rig. Brakes gone on main
drum. Leave csg. to flow-back tank. S.D.F.D. (Rick) DC 35400 (caught
up 2 7/8” work string rentals, to date) CC $8,025,823

Repairing rig. Was able to keep rentals on holiday shut dn status until we
resume work. Rig repaired this PM and ready to work. (SCE) DC $0

20 fcp. Pump 40 bbls. down tbg. R.LH. w/ 100 jts. tbg. Well kicked.
Pump 30 bbls. down tbg. R.LH. w/ 2 jts. tbg. R.U. Swivel. Swivel down
3 jts. tbg. Tagged Fish top @ 15,916° w/ 513 jts. tbg. total. Try to work
over fish. Saw 7K over-pull and slip off.(Possibly a wedge-friction bite)
Worked several more times. Still no luck. Rack —back swivel. P.O.0.H.
w/ 9 jts. tbg.(laying down) Leave csg to flow-back tank. Drain pump &
lines. S.D.F.N. (RICK) DC 17110 CC 8,042,933

SD for holiday

20 fcp 1600 sitp. Pump 40 bbls. down tbg. P.O.O.H. (and LD)w/ 100 jts.
tbg. Well kicked. Pump 40 bbls. down tbg. P.O.O.H. w/ 57 jts. tbg.
Well kicked. Pump 30 bbls. down tbg. P.O.O.H. w/ 51 jts. tbg. Drain
pump & lines. Leave csg. to flow-back tank. S.D.F.N. (RICK) DC
10425 CC $8,053,358

20 fcp 1500 sitp. Pump 60 bbls. down tbg. P.O.O.H. w/ 151 jts. tbg.
Well kicked. Pump 10 bbls. down tbg. P.O.O.H. w/ 50 jts. thg. Well
kicked. Pump 80 bbls. down tbg. P.O.0.H. w/ 50 jts. tbg. Drain pump &
lines. Leave csg. flowing to flow-back tank & S.D.F.N. (RICK) DC
11425 CC 8,064,783

20 fcp 500 sitp. Pump 80 bbls. down tbg. Finish P.O.O.H. w/ 43 jts. tbg.,
x-over, 2-intensifiers, x-over, drill collar, x-over, jars,bumper sub,x-over,
x-over, 2-jts. tbg., x-over, overshot w/ 2 7/8 grapple. Saw scratch marks
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1/6/09

1/7/09

1/8/09

1/9/09

1/10/09

on bottom of cut-lip guide & marks on grapple control & grapple. NO
SIGN OF BEING OVER MUD MOTOR ASSEMBLY. N.D. BOP
Stack. N.U. Frac valve. Rack out pump & tank. Assist in loading out
rental tbg. & bop’s. R.D.S.U. Leave well shut in. S.D.F.N. (RICK) DC
10578 CC 8,075,361

Road rig off loc. Filling frac tks for Mancos fracs. (SCE)

Pet well thru separator for test w/ 2500 SICP. Sold 165 MCF head gas
thru high pressure line, then pulled sep dn to 125 psi and put on test.

350 FCP. Made 189 MCF and 0 BW, on 10/64” ck, w/ 150 psi on sep.
Changed ck to 14/64 and dropped sep to 120 psi. (testing, gas going to pit)
(SCE)

300 FCP. Made 166 MCF and 45 BW on 14/64” ck, 120 psi on sep.
(SCE)

250 FCP. Made 141 MCF and 15 BW on 14/64” ck. Not making any
water now. (SCE)
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CONFIDENTIY

GASCO Production Company

Lease: Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15
Legal: NE SW of Sec 16-T11S-R15E
Duchesne County, UT
API: 43-013-32685

TOC inside surface csg.
06/27/08 Final Drilling Report
(PME) DC $111,086 CC $6,258,778
06/30/08 Dispose of Reserve Pit water RECEIVED
(PME) DC $11,661 CC $6,270,439 C
FEB 17 2009
07/15/08 Set tanks (@ start battery construction.
(PME) DC $26,745 CC $6,297,184 DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
7/31/08 Late costs: Cover pit, set tanks,/build tank battery
(PME) DC $71,977 CC $6,369,161
Completion
9/10/08 Complete tank battery (PME) DC $20,096 CC $6,422,333
9/11/08 When csg was landed and csg head installed it was not installed straight.
MIRU Weatherford csg jacks. Pull 200,000#’s on csg. WHI cut csg head
and 5 4 csg off. Reinstall 9 5/8” csg head and set 5 %2 in slips. Install
tbg head. SDFD. (JD)
9/30/08 KCL, Frac water, Tanks hauled, Tank Rent
(PME) DC $135,777 CC $6,558,110
10/10/08 Disposal of Water, Insulation for tank battery
(PME) DC $31,380 CC $6,589,490
10/21/08 Wire for computer hook up, correction for pit on 7/31/08
(PME) DC $-16,045 CC $6,573,445
10/29/08 RU Superior ws to frac. Psi test csg to 12,300 psi, watch for 5 min. test

good. RU RIH w/3 1/8” scalloped guns 3spf 120 degree phasing. Tag @
16,477, Decision as per (JDL, Mike logan XTO) to move bottom set of
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10/30/08

10/31/08

11/1/08

11/2/08

11/3/08

- 11/4/08

perfs to 16,446-50°. Perf stage-1 Morrison /16,486-90°, 16,450-54.
POOH. RU to frac. Bleed well off to 2,000 psi. Well did not build any psi.
Bleed well off to 200 psi, well built to 217 psi. Break dn perfs w/10,984 @
3.5 bpm. Hybrid frac well w/5,000# 100 mesh, 70,000# 18/40 Versa
prop sand, 1,518 bbls 30# XL-BHT gel, and flushed w/344 bbls 10#
linear gel/fresh water. SD. ISIP 9,593 FG 1.021. 5 min SI19,049. Average
rate 35 bpm, average psi 10,700. Job pumped very well. Turn well over to
b @ 4:40 p.m. w/9,900 on a 8/64 ck. SDFD. (JDL, SCE, JD, MO)

(PME) DC $128,098 CC $6,701,534

7:00 a.m. 700 on a 10/64 ck. Made 952 bbls in 14 hrs 20 min, TR 952 bbls
BLWTR 910 bbls. RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP @
16,256, well psi built to 4,200. Perf stage-2 Dakota £/16,224-34’. POOH.
RU to frac. Break dn perfs w/9,499 @ 5.2 bpm. Hybrid frac well
w/5,000% 100 mesh, 85,000# 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,648 bbls 30#
XL-BHT gel, and flushed w/341 bbls 10# linear gel/fresh water. SD. ISIP
9,940 FG 1.06. Average rate 35 bpm, average psi 11,250. Job pumped
very well. Watch well for 30 min. 5 min SI9,272, 10 min SI 9,000, 15 min
SI 8,924, 20 min SI 8,878, 25 min SI 8,848, 30 min SI SI 8,818. Open
well up to fb @ 12:51 p.m. w/8,800 on an 8/64 ck. SDFD. (JD, JDL, MO)
(PME) DC $ 137,658 CC $6,839,201

SWI @ 10:00 p.m. (10/29/08) w/900 on a 12/64 ck. Made 636 bbls in 9
hrs 35 min, TR 1,641 bbls, BLWTR 2,210 bbls. RU RIH w/plug and guns.
Tag @ 16,033°. Top perf stage-2 16,112°, 79” to high. POOH. Open well
up to fb and well psi fell to 100 psi in 15 min. Decision was made to bring
in coil tbg to wash out well. RDMO stinger+JW wireline+frac equipment
needed. Open well up to fb w/5,500 on a 8/64 ck. SDFD. (JD)

7:00 200 on a 8/64 ck. Made 250 bbls, TR 1,891 bbls, BLWTR 1,960 bbls.

7:00 am. 200 on a 8/64 ck. Made 152 bbls in 24 hrs, TR 2,043 bbls,
BLWTR 1,808 bbls.

7:00 am. 200 on a 8/64 ck. Made 76 bbls in 24 hrs, TR 2,119 bbls,
BLWTR 1,732 bbls. RU CTS coil tbg. RIH w/2 7/8 wash nozzle. Tag sand
@ 16,033 wash dn to plug @ 16,256. Circ and POOH. Saw lot of sand in
returns. SWIL. SDFD. JD) DC 3566 CC 6,842,767

RU Stinger+JW wireline. RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP
@ 16,170° Perfs stage-3 Dakota £/16,112-22° POOH. RU to frac. Break
dn perfs w/9,894 @ 3 bpm. during pre pad @ 10,800 w/38 bpm the well
head blew apart. 0 injuries occurred. The slip collar that was welded to
the 5 4" csg pulled apart and well head came off @ the tbg head. RIH
w/10k Magnum Bridge plug, Set plug @ 10,000 POOH. RIH w/dump
bailer and set 10’ cement on top of plug. POOH. When OOH the glass in
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11/5/08

11/6/08

11/7/08

11/8/08

11/12/08

11/13/08

11/14/08

11/15/08

bailer did not break. Reload bailer and RIH. Set 10’ of cement on top of
plug. POOH. RIH w/10k Magnum bridge plug, set plug @ 5,000°. POOH.
SDFD. (JD)

(PME) DC $40,928 CC $6,883,695

No work on well today. Meet w/ Boots & Coots (Richard Hatteberg, John
Reece) @ well site to determine how to fix well head. (JD)

RDMO Superior frac equipment, Stinger, JW wireline. Dig out around
well head to expose 13 5/8” conductor pipe. Will have WHI on location in
the a.m. to repair well head. (JD)

No work on well today. Waiting on wellhead parts. (JD)

WHI on location. Dig down around 13 5/8” csg and cut off. Cut slip collar
off 9 5/8” csg. Re-weld csg head on 9 5/8”. Install tbg head and set self
energizing slips around 5 %" csg. Psi test seals on 9 5/8” to 2,400 psi. test
seals on 5 '2” to 12,500 psi. SDFD. (JD)

MIRU CTS coil tbg. RIH w/ 4.454 Convex clear cut mill+2 7/8” ECTD
even wall motor+2 7/8” jars+disconnect+tcirc sub. Did not see plug #1 @
5,000’ tag up @ 6,000’ drill off. Tag @ 7,000 drill off. Tag plug # 2 @
9,980’ drill for four hours holding 4,000 back psi. had to surge dn to 1,200
several times to keep bit clean to drill. Drill up and saw 4,300 psi fcp. Psi
bled down to 200 psi in 30 min. RIH. Tag @ 14,740° drill off saw 0 psi
inc. RIH tag plug #3 @ 16,170 Pick up for weight check. RIH plug gone.
RIH tag plug #4 @ 16,250, Drill for 2 hrs could not make any hole.
Circulate bottoms up and SWI. POOH. RDMO CTS. SDFD. (JD)

No work on-well today.

Fd SICP 4,500. RU JW wireline. RIH w/plug. Set 10k Magnum FTFP @
16,148’ POOH. RU to frac. Pump into perfs w/9,380 @ 3.2 bpm. Hybrid
frac well w/5,000# 100 mesh, 75,000# 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,549
bbls 30# XL-BHT gel, and flushed w/342 bbls 2% kcl. SD. ISIP 9,851
FG 1.05 Average rate 40 bpm, average psi 10,500. SWI1. SDFD. (JD)

FD SICP 8,000. RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP @
15,950’ Perf stage-4 Dakota silt {/15,839-43°, 15,869-73°, 15,912-16’.
Break dn perfs w/9,111 @ 3.3 bpm. Hybrid frac well w/5,000% 100
mesh, 65,000# 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,200 bbls XI. BHT gel, and
flushed w/332 bbls 2% kcl. SD. ISIP 8,994 FG 1.01 Average rate 39 bpm,
average psi 9,500. Turn well over to tb @ 5:45 p.m. w/8,500 on a 10/64
ck. SDFD. (JD)
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11/16/08

11/17/08

11/18/08

11/19/08

11/20/08

6:00 a.m. 900 on a 12/64 ck. Made 649 bbls in 12 hrs 15 min, TR 2,777,
BLWTR 4,497 bbls. RU CTS coil tbg. RIH w/ 4.454 convex clear cut
mill+ 2 7/8” ECTD even wall motor+disconnect+circ sub+jarstmotor
head+disconnect. Holding 1,700 back psi, tag plug #1 @ 15,945 motor
stalled and saw 2,600 psi inc. Pick and tbg stuck. Work up/dn several
times. Pump nitrogen dn coil to lift sand. Saw heavy sand @ pit returns.
Pull to 80% of coil tbg max. Tbg still stuck. SWI for night to let equalize.
SDFD. (JD)

Fd 6,000 sicp. Pull to 80% of tbg max, tbg still stuck. Open well up to
flow back to bring psi dn. Talk w/(JDL) drop disconnect ball. Saw ball hit
tbg still stuck. Drop circ sub ball. Did not see ball hit. SWI. Tbg and well
equalized and psi came up together, indicating possible hole in tbg string.
Drop final disconnect ball. Did not see ball hit. Pull to 80% of max one
last time and tbg still stuck. Turn well over to fb until decision is made.
Open well @ 12:37 p.m. w/1,300 on a 12/64 ck. SDFD. (JD)

7:00 a.m. 1,000 on a 16/64 ck. Made 433 bbls in 18 hrs 23 min, TR 3,210
bbls, BLWTR 4,064 bbls. No work on well today, waiting on pipe
recovery tools.

7:00 am. 500 on a 20 ck. Made 389 bbls in 23 hrs, TR 3,599 bbls,
BLWTR 3,675 bbls. RU JW wireline. Shut cts BOP and set slips. Bleed
off lubricator. Disconnect lubricator, pick up under injector and cut coil
tbg. Install plug and feed coil back through injector. Set injector back on
wellhead. Pull plug and install 10k TIW valve. RIH inside coil w/free
point tools w/50,000# pulled tension @ injector. Tag @ 15,706’. Could
not see free point. Pull out of hole to 12,000#, slack off to 35,000# and
work up to 50,000# see fp. When slacked off to 35,000# could not get past
15,468’. Slack in pipe would bend pipe not allowing it to go down. Pull
tension to 50,000# RIH. Find free point @ 15,706’. POOH. RIH find
unassisted fp @ 35,000# tension. Flag pipe for cut @ 15,468’. POOH.
SDED. (JD)

7:00 a.m. 100 on a 32 ck. Made 399 bbls in 23 hrs 11 min, TR 3,998 bbls,
BLWTR 3,276. 55% TL recovered. RIH w/gun. Perf 1 shot @ 15,468’
POOH. When perf gun shot a 4’ long 17 diameter balance bar parted from
gun and was left in the hole. Should be inside fish top. RIH w/(RTC)
radial cutting torch. Cut coil tbg off @ 15,468°. Pull to 65,000#. Tbg
finished parting, now free. POOH RTC tool. When RTC fired a 4’ long 17
diameter balance bar parted from RTC tool and was left in the hole.
Should be inside fish top. POOH RTC tool. RDMO JW wire line. Cut
1,100’ coil tbg off reel. Attach coil to reel and POOH coil tbg. SWI to
build psi, will turn to sales when psi builds to 1,000#’s to over come 700
psi sales line. SDFD. (JD) Left in hole 477’ 1 %” coil tbg .156 wall
thickness, 2.656 ppf, 70,270# pipe body yield,+ 2 4’ by 1”dia balance
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11/21/08

11/22/08

11/23/08

11/24/08

11/25/08

11/26/08

"bar+2 7/8” Motor head assembly, (possibly disconnected)+2 7/8” dual

acting jars+2 7/8” high tensile disconnect (possibly disconnected)+2 7/8”
ECTD even wall motor+4.450 Convex clear cut mill. SDFD. (JD)

7:00 am. 100 on a 32/64 ck. Made 151 bbls in 18 hrs TR 4,128 bbls
BLWTR 3,146 bbls. Turn well over to sales w/1,300 on a 16/64 ck and psi
fell off in 1 hr to equal sales line. Well would no longer sale gas. Take
back to tank to try to unload water. (JD)

7:00 am 800 on a 18/64 ck. Made 21 bbls in 12 hrs 17 min TR 4,149 bbls,
BLWTR 3,125 bbls.

7:00 a.m. 200 on a 24/64 ck. Made 302 bbls in 24 hrs, TR 4,451 bbls,
BLWTR 2,823 bbls.

7:00 a.m. 200 on a 24/64 ck. Made 138 bbls in 24 hrs. TR 4,589 bbls,
BLWTR 2,689 bbls.

7:00 a.m. 200 on a 24/64 ck. Made 123 bbls in 24 hrs, TR 4,709 bbls,
BLWTR 2,565 bbls.

SWI for psi build test. Release flow back crew until 11/30/08. (JD)

Rig up Workover to start fishing job (for stuck coil tbg)

12-03-08

12-04-08

12-06-08

12-09-08

100 fcp. M.ILS.U. from L.T. 14-14-9-19. (WILDCAT) Spot in all
equipment. R.U. Rig. Unload 380 jts. PH-6 TBG. onto pipe racks.
S.D.FN. (RIG WILL BE DOWN FOR APPROX. 2 DAYS FOR
REPAIRS) DC 8150 CC 6,891,845

100 fcp 116 bbls in 24 hrs, TR 5,173 bbls, BLWTR 2,101 bbls. Unload
170 jts. PH-6 tbg. onto pipe racks. Rig crew still working on rig. (RICK)
DC 1070

50 fcp Made 118 bbls in 24 hrs, TR 5,289 bbls, BLWTR 1,983 bbls Pump
50 bbls. down csg. N.D. Frac tree. N.U. BOP STACK. R.U. FLOOR. R.U.
Flow line. S.D.F.N. (RICK) DC 11,080 CC $6,903,995

50 fcp. Pump 100 bbls. down csg. P.U. & R.IL.H. w/ 3 % Oversocket W/ 4
1% 0.D.Guide, x-over, 16 jts. tbg. (PH-6), x-over, x-over, lbs.,jars,x-over,
1-drill collar(3 '), 2- intensifiers,x-over, 30 jts. tbg. (PH-6) Well kicked.
Pump 15 bbls. down tbg. Well still flowing. Pump 80 bbls. down tbg.
R.LH. w/ 34 jts. tbg. Well kicked. Pump 20 bbls. down tbg. R.LH. w/ 19
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12-10-08

12-11-08

12-12-08

12-13-08

12-14-08

12-15-2008

12-15-08

jts. tbg. SD.FEN. (RICK) (TOTAL IN HOLE = 99 JTS. TBG.)
DC 15497 CC $6,919,492

50 fcp. Bleed off thg. Pump 20 bbls down tbg. Well still trying to flow.
Pump 30 bbls. down tbg. R.LH. w/ 14 jts. tbg. Well kicked. Let tbg. flow
back to tank. Pump 50 bbls. down tbg. R.LH. w/56 jts. tbg. Well kicked.
Let tbg unload to tank. Pump 50 bbls. down tbg. R.IL.H. w/ 74 jts. tbg.
Well kicked. Pump 50 bbls. down tbg. R.ILH. w/ 55 jts. tbg. Drain pump
& lines. S.D.F.N. TOTAL IN HOLE = 299. (RICK) DC 10260 CC
$6,929,752

50 fcp 1400 sitp. Blow down tbg. Pump 50 bbls. down tbg. R.LH. w/ 24
jts. tbg. Tie back to single fast. Change over elevators to YT’s. Well
kicked. Pump 50 bbls. down tbg. R.I.LH. w/ 78 jts. tbg. Drain pump &
lines. TOTAL=411 JTS. PH-6. S.L.W. & S.D.EN. (RICK) DC 16415
CC 6,946,167

2000 sicp 2000sitp. Pump 62 bbls. down tbg. Bleed csg. to flow-back
tank on 24/64 choke. R.LH. w/ 34 jts. tbg. Base beam for rig started to
sink. (SANK APPROX. 6° ON WELL HEAD SIDE) R.D.S.U. & Move
out of way. Had J & R fill in sink hole and re-level ground for base
beam. Set down drilling rig pad 8’ x 40’ (twice as big as the last one) to
put rig base beam onto. S.IW. & S.D.F.N. (RICK) DC 12540 CC
6,958,707

2000 sicp 2000 sitp. R.U. S.U. Pump 65 bbls. down tbg. R.I.H. w/ 51
jts. tbg. R.U. Power swivel. Pump 200 bbls. down tbg. (caught pressure
@ 102 bbls. circ. after 194 bbls.) RILH. w/ 2 jts. tbg. w/ swivel. Drain
pump & lines. S.I.W. & S.D.F.N. TOTAL IN HOLE = 497 JTS. TBG.
(RICK) DC 14515 CC 6,973,222

1300 sicp 1000 sitp. H.U. Pump & lines. Blow down csg. to flow-back
tank. Pump 60 bbls. down tbg. R.LH. w/ 1 jt. tbg. Tagged on # 499 w/
14’ in. Swivel down 14 jts. tbg. Tag on jt. # 513. Jar on fish. Pulling up
to 50 k over string wt. Made 7 ¢ of hole in 45 min. Fish began to drag out
of hole 30- 45 k over sting wt. Swivel out 15 jts. tbg. (laying down) Drain
pump & lines.S.LW. & S.D.F.N. (RICK) DC 13915 CC 6,987,137

2000 sicp 1500 sitp. H.U. Pump & lines/ Put csg. to flow-back tank.
Bleed off tbg. to flat tank. Pump 30 bbl. down tbg. Rack-back swivel.
P.O.0.H. and SB 158 jts. tbg. (Rig tied back single line, very slow)(Put on
hyt elevators) Drain pump & lines. S.D.E.N. (RICK) DC 13970
CC $7,001,107

Updated costs for Fracs: (PME) $885,667 $7,886,774
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12-16-08

12-17-08

12-18-08

12-19-08

12/20/08

12/21/08

12/22/08

12/23/08

50 fcp 1100 sitp. H.U. Pump & lines. Pump 30 bbls. down tbg.
P.O.0.H. w/ 202 jts. tbg. Tie rig back to double fast. Well kicked. Pump
20 bbls. down tbg. P.O.0.H. w/ 80 jts. tbg. Well kicked. Pump 15 bbls.
down tbg. P.O.O.H. w/ 2 jts. tbg. Well kicked. Pump 70 bbls. down tbg.
P.O.0.H. w/ 40 jts. tbg., 2-intensifiers, 1- drill collar, jars, bumper sub, 2-
x-overs, 16 jts. tbg. Found fish in oversocket. Lay down 1 jt. tbg. Well
kicked. S.I. tbg. Close pipe rams & pull upset up to rams. Leave csg.
flowing to flow-back tank for night. Drain pump & lines. S.D.F.N.
(RICK) DC 16240 CC 7,903,014

20 fcp. H.U. Pump & lines. Pump 80 bbls. down csg. (leave pump
trickling) P.O.O.H. w/ 420’ of 1 %”coil tbg. Oversocket slipped and
crushed entire fish, and caught the last 12 of fish to POOH. Leave csg. to
flow-back tank. S.D.F.N. (RICK) DC 13510 CC 7,916,524

20 fcp. H.U. Pump & lines/ Pump 97 bbls. down csg. R.ILH. w/ 4 4
shoe, bushing,2-jts. wash-pipe,top sub,x-over,b.s.,jar,x-over,collar,2-
intensifiers, 66 jts. tbg.,Well kicked. Pump 15 bbls.down tbg. R.LH. w/ 18
jts. tbg. Well kicked. Pump 10 bbls. down tbg. R.I.H. w/ 110 jts. tbg.
Well kicked. Pump 10 bbls. down thg. R.LH. w/ 86 jts. tbg. (total in hole
=280 jts. tbg.) Leave csg. open to flow-back tank. Drain pump & lines &
S.D.F.N. (RICK) DC 8340 CC $7,924,864

100 fcp 200 sitp. H.U. Pump & lines. Pump 40 bbls.down tbg. R.LH. w/
40 jts. tbg. Tie-back & change over to HYT elevators. Well kicked.

Pump 40 bbls. down tbg. R.LH. w/ 48 jts. tbg. Well kicked. Pump 30
bbls. down tbg. R.LH. w/ 130 jts. tbg. P.U. 7 jts. tbg. off racks. Leave
csg. to flow-back tank & S.D.F.N.(TOTAL IN =505 JTS. TBG.) (RICK)
DC 17902 CC $7,942,766

Fin RIH w/ last 5 jts (total 511 jts). Tagged fish 27’ high. Broke (reverse)
circ, dn csg and up tbg. Washed over and started milling w/ tag jt almost
down. Milled 1 1/2° and started spinning. Not able to make any more
hole in over an hr. Start OOH w/ tbg. SB 23 stds. SDFN (SCE) DC
18107 CC $7,960,873

Unable to start mud pump. WO parts. Finally start OOH and wind blew
stds out of fingers on tbg board. POOH w/ 23 more stds. SDFN. (SCE)
DC 6870 CC $7,967,743

Cont to POOH w/ tbg. SDFN w/ total of 458 jts out. (SCE) DC 14095
CC $7,981,838

Kill tbg, POOH w/ last 53 jts tbg. LD wash pipe BHA. Found burnover
shoe with no Kut-rite left on bottom, and very little on inside. Outside of
shoe worn dn 1/16”. Found 14” of marks inside of shoe, indicating 14” of
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12-24-08

burnover. SDFN while obtaining and short catch cut lip guide for
overshot. Will start in hole in AM w/ overshot. (SCE) DC 7320 CC
$7,980,818

50 fcp. Pump 80 bbls. down csg. P.U. & R.LH. w/ overshot, x-over, 2 jts.
tbg., x-over, x-over, bs., jars, x-over, drill collar, x-over, 2-intensifiers, x-
over, 120 jts. tbg. Well kicked. Pump 20 bbls. down tbg. R.I.H. w/ 180
jts. tbg. Tie back. Change elevators. Well kicked. Pump 20 bbls. down
tbg. R.LH. w/ 104 jts. tbg. Leave csg. to flow-back tank. S.D.F.N. (Rick)
DC 9605 CC $7,990,423

12-25 thru 12/28, SD for holidays

12-30-08

12/31/08

1-1-09

1/2/09

1-3-09

1-4-09

1-5-09

20 fcp 1400 sitp. Hook up pump & lines. Pump 40 bbls. down tbg.
R.LH. w/ 2 jts. tbg. Tried to adjust brakes on rig. Brakes gone on main
drum. Leave csg. to flow-back tank. S.D.F.D. (Rick) DC 35400 (caught
up 2 7/8” work string rentals, to date) CC $8,025,823

Repairing rig. Was able to keep rentals on holiday shut dn status until we
resume work. Rig repaired this PM and ready to work. (SCE) DC $0

20 fcp. Pump 40 bbls. down tbg. R.ILH. w/ 100 jts. tbg. Well kicked.
Pump 30 bbls. down tbg. R.LH. w/ 2 jts. tbg. R.U. Swivel. Swivel down
3 jts. tbg. Tagged Fish top @ 15,916° w/ 513 jts. tbg. total. Try to work
over fish. Saw 7K over-pull and slip off.(Possibly a wedge-friction bite)
Worked several more times. Still no luck. Rack —back swivel. P.O.O.H.
w/ 9 jts. tbg.(laying down) Leave csg to flow-back tank. Drain pump &
lines. S.D.F.N. (RICK) DC 17110 CC 8,042,933

SD for holiday

20 fcp 1600 sitp. Pump 40 bbls. down tbg. P.O.O.H. (and LD)w/ 100 jts.
tbg. Well kicked. Pump 40 bbls. down tbg. P.O.O.H. w/ 57 jts. tbg.
Well kicked. Pump 30 bbls. down tbg. P.O.O.H. w/ 51 jts. tbg. Drain
pump & lines. Leave csg. to flow-back tank. S.D.F.N. (RICK) DC
10425 CC $8,053,358

20 fcp 1500 sitp. Pump 60 bbls. down tbg. P.O.O.H. w/ 151 jts. tbg.
Well kicked. Pump 10 bbls. down tbg. P.O.O.H. w/ 50 jts. tbg. Well
kicked. Pump 80 bbls. down tbg. P.O.O.H. w/ 50 jts. tbg. Drain pump &
lines. Leave csg. flowing to flow-back tank & S.D.F.N. (RICK) DC
11425 CC 8,064,783

20 fep 500 sitp. Pump 80 bbls. down tbg. Finish P.O.O.H. w/ 43 jts. tbg.,
x-over, 2-intensifiers, x-over, drill collar, x-over, jars,bumper sub,x-over,
x-over, 2-jts. tbg., x-over, overshot w/ 2 7/8 grapple. Saw scratch marks
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1/6/09

1/7/09

1/8/09

1/9/09

1/10/09

1/11/09

1/12/09

1/13/09

1/14/09

1/19/09

on bottom of cut-lip guide & marks on grapple control & grapple. NO
SIGN OF BEING OVER MUD MOTOR ASSEMBLY. N.D. BOP
Stack. N.U. Frac valve. Rack out pump & tank. Assist in loading out
rental thg. & bop’s. R.D.S.U. Leave well shut in. S.D.F.N. (RICK) DC
10578 CC 8,075,361

Road rig off loc. Filling frac tks for Mancos fracs. (SCE)
Update Costs (PME) DC $432,235 CC $8,507,596

Pet well thru separator for test w/ 2500 SICP. Sold 165 MCF head gas
thru high pressure line, then pulled sep dn to 125 psi and put on test.
Update Costs (PME) DC $4,055 CC $8,511,651

350 FCP. Made 189 MCF and 0 BW, on 10/64” ck, w/ 150 psi on sep.
Changed ck to 14/64 and dropped sep to 120 psi. (testing, gas going to pit)
(SCE)

300 FCP. Made 166 MCF and 45 BW on 14/64” ck, 120 psi on sep.
(SCE)
Update Costs (PME) DC $4,455 CC $8,516,106

250 FCP. Made 141 MCF and 15 BW on 14/64” ck. Not making any
water now. Shut well in at 12:00 noon, Fri, 1/9/09. (SCE)

Made 62 MCF and 0 BW on 14/64” ck, before shutting in. Opened well
back up at 11:00 AM, Sat, 1/10/09.

When well was turned back on, sold 73 MCF (against 704 psi high line
pressure, for 2 hrs), then bled down to 60 psi line pressure and produced
total of 153 MCEF (inc gas that was sold). Well flowing on 14/64” ck, and
made 40 BW, w/ 150 FCP. Update Costs (PME) DC $3,133 CC
$8,519,239

Shut well in @ 8:30 AM, Monday 1/12/09to build pressure for frac plug.
Made 51 MCF (since midnight). Made 35 BW. Flowing w/ 150 FCP on
14/64” ck, against 60 line pressure.

Parts (PME) DC $106 CC $8,519,345

Rentals from Myton Rental (PME) DC $19,220 CC $8,538,565
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1/20/09

1/21/09

1/22/09

1/23/09

Fd 5,600 sicp. RU RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Cast Iron FTFP @
15,320’ Perf stage-5 Lower Mancos /15,260-64’ Try to break dn perfs
and would not break. Perf 15,238-42’ Perf would still not break. Perf
15,180-84° Psi up to 9,500 Max of lubricator and was able to turn a drive
line, but could not establish good rate. POOH. When we got to surface
w/guns they would not come into lubricator it had built up hydrates that
would not allow guns to come into the lubricator. Try to crack seal on
grease head and it shot gun into the lubricator and parted the line. Shut
stinger valve and break lubricator. Fd guns were inside lubricator. Try to
flow well and the well head and manifold hydrated off. Pump up to 12,000
psi and could see psi breaks was able to inject 10 bbls and then pressured
up. Flow well and retrieve water then it would hydrate off. Repeat process
several times and could not get it to break up. SWI. Put heaters on well
head and SDFD. (JD)

Manlift Rental (PME) DC $2,348 CC $8,540,913

Fd 7,000 psi sicp. Fill lubricator and well head full of methanol and open
well head to let drop out for 20 min. Try to pump and well psi up. Work
up/dn psi up to 11,000 and let flow dn to 1,000. Could not get a break.
Repeat process several times. B&C quick test on location. Pump
methanol dn well @ 10,000 psi, then let It flow dn to O psi. repeat process
several times and could not get a break. Pump methanol until well would
not take any more fluid and SWI. Put heaters on well head and SDFD.
CTS coil tbg will be on location in the a.m. (JD)

Coil tubing & Test casing (PME) DC $48,798 CC $8,589,711

Fd 7,000 sicp. MIRU CTS coil tbg. RIH w/2 7/8” wash nozzle holding
7,500 back psi pumping 130 degree water. Tag hydrate plug @ 207° wash
through slowly to +/- 400°. RIH to 3,000’. Circulate for about 1 hr. POOH
slowly shutting well in to let gas build then blow psi dn to pit. When OOH
the well had 3,500 csg psi. Open well up to fb on a 10/64 ck. RDMO CTS.
@ 12:00 a.m. the well had 2,100 sicp. RU JW wireline and RIH w/plug
and guns. Set 10k magnum aluminum bridge plug @ 15,312°. Finish
perf stage-5 Lower mancos {/14,995-99°, 15,058-62°, 15,087-91°,
15,157-61°. POOH. Open well up to fb w/2,100 on a 10/64 ck.

SWI @ 4:00 a.m. w/1,500 on a 10/64 ck. Made 5 bbls in 3 hrs. RU Stinger
well head. RU The rest of superior frac iron. Stinger valve had a small
leak, pump 60 bbls warm water dn well. Well pressured up and broke dn
perfs w/10,378 @ 3 bpm. SD. Isip 9,716 FG 1.08 Shut in stinger and leak
stopped. When superior went to psi test the rest of the truck’s @ 10,000
psi one of the ears on the discharge pump failed and blew apart pulling the
studs out of the truck. SD frac job and inspect iron. Fd several pieces of
iron that were questionable and had to go to town and be inspected by a
certified inspector. Will continue to frac when the equipment is safe to do
s0. Open well up to fb w/8,700 on a 10/64 ck. (JD)
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1/24/09

1/25/09

1/26/09

1/27/09

1/28/09

1/29/08

(PME) Frac water hauled DC $47,873 CC $8,637,276

7:00 a.m. 2,100 on a 8/64 ck. Made 60 bbls in 13 hrs 39 min. TR 60 bbls.
Misc. costs, KCL, Trucking, heater rental, deliver mudd cross
(PME) DC $237,027 CC $8,874,303

- SWI @ 6:30 a.m. w/1,900 on a 8/64 ck. Made 0 bbls in 22 hrs 30 min, TR

60 bbls. RU to frac. Pump into perfs w/10,060 @ 6 bpm. SD ISIP 9,367
FG 1.06 Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick water/linear gel frac well
w/68,700# PRC 6000 premium 40/70 sand, 4,590 bbls Fr slick
water/linear gel, and flushed w/330 bbls FR slick water. SD. ISIP 8,654
FG 1.02 Average rate 38 bpm, average psi 9,700. RIH w/plug and guns.
Set 10k magnum bio ball FTFP @ 14,954°, Perf stage-6 Lower Mancos
II £/14,916-20° Break dn perfs w/9,200. Finish perf 1/14,550-54°, 14,601-
05°, 14,743-47°, 14,771-75°, 14,822-26’. POOH. RU to frac. Pump into
perfs w/9,100 @ 2.4 bpm. SD. ISIP 8,553 FG 1.02 Pump 1,000 gal 7.5%
HCL. FR slick water/linear gel frac well w/81,000# PR 6000 premium
40/70 sand, 5,320 bbls FR slick water/linear gel, and flushed w/333 bbls
FR slick water. Dropped 8 bio ball’s in #3 1# stage, saw excellent ball
action and psi break. Drop 8 bio ball’s in #4 1# stage saw good ball action
and psi break. Drop 8 ball’s in #5 1# stage, did not see any ball action. SD.
ISIP 8,510 FG 1.02 Average rate 46 bpm, average psi 9,800 SWI. SDFD.
(JD) (PME) DC $246,201 CC $9,120,504

No work on well today hauling water.
(PME) DC $21,211 CC $9,141,715

Fd 7,700 sicp. RIH w/plug and guns. Tag something @ 12,600° and
cannot move up hole. Open well on a 8/64 ck. 0 movement on collar
locator. Pump 1 bpm w/frac crew and started to see movement. Was able
to go dn but not up. Flush 130 bbls past plug and still 0 movement. Set
plug @ 12,740’ and POOH. Will have coil tbg on location in the a.m. SWI
SDFD. (JD) (PME) DC § 25,614 CC $9,167,329

Open well up to tb @ 11:43 a.m. w/8,700 on a 8/64 ck.
(PME) DC $46,018 CC $9,233,938

MIRU CTS coil tbg. When putting BOP on well head the flange between
the master valve and the tbg head started to leak gas. SD and RD cts. Turn
well over to sales @ 4:51 p.m. w/ 7,400 on a 10/64 ck.

(PME) DC $8,456 CC $9,242,394
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1/30/09

1/31/09

2/1/09

2/2/09

2/3/09

7:00 a.m. 4,850 on a 12/64 ck. Made 432 bbls in 21 hrs 26 min. TR 1,212
bbls, BLWTR 9,421 bbls. Change ck from 12/64 to 10/64 @ 8:00 and psi
went up to 5,000 and stabilized. (PME) DC $8,626 CC $9,251,020

7:00 a.m. 4,200 on a 10/64 ck. TR 1,216 bbls, BLWTR 9,417 bbls. Gas
flow rate 2.009 Mcfd (avg 2.2 MCFD for 24 hr period). The dump valve
on the separator failed to operate over night. Daily water make will not be
accurate. MIRU JW wireline RIH plug. Set 10k Magnum bridge plug @
12,000° POOH. Bleed well dn to 2,500 psi. RU Wood group psi control.
RIH tbg hanger + 2” back psi valve. Bleed off master valve and pull off.
Clean sealing surface and replace ring gasket. Reinstall 77 10k master
valve with torque wrench. POOH 2” back psi valve + tbg hanger. MIRU
CTS coil tbg. Will drill plugs in the A M. SDFD. (JD)

(PME) DC $195,898 CC $9,446,918

RIH w/3 5/8” clear cut mill + 2 7/8” ECTD even wall motor + circ sub +
2 7/8” jars + MHA / disconnect. Holding 8,000 psi back pressure, tag plug
#1 @ 12,015, Drill for 1 hr and started to back ck dn to 7,500 then to
7,000 and was able to drill through. Saw 0 psi inc. RIH tag plug #2 @
12,740°. Holding 6,500 psi drill up and saw O psi inc. RIH tag plug #3 @
14,954’ drill and saw O psi inc. RIH tag PB (CIBP, flow thru)@ 15,284’
Circ and POOH. RDMO CTS coil. Open well up to FB @ 11:00 p.m. w/
6,200 on a 10/64 ck. SDFD. (JD)

7:00 a.m. 5,000 on a 10/64 ck. Made 179 bbls in 8 hrs, TR 1,795 bbls,
BLWTR 8,838 bbls. (TR and BLWTR #’s have been corrected for water
that went down sales line). SWI and RU stinger isolation tool. Open well
up to sales @ 1:17 p.m. w/7,700 on a 10/64 ck. Gas rate, 4200 Mcfe @
6:00 p.m. gas rate 935 Mcfe, water make came up to 10 bbls/hr. (JD)

7:00 a.m. 4,200 on a 8/64 ck. Made 104 bbls in 19 hrs 16 min, TR 1,899
bbls, BLWTR 8,734. Gas rate 1,200 Mcfe. SWI @ 1:04 p.m. w/3,800 on
a 10/64 ck. RU superior and pump flush on well w/9,850 @ 10 bpm. RIH
w/plug and guns. Set 10k magnum bio ball FTFP @ 14,504°. Perf stage-
7 Lower Mancos III {/14,092-96°, 14,252-56°, 14,342-46’, 14,365-69,
14,433-37°, 14,475-79°. POOH. When pulling up to shoot second set of
perfs the guns got stuck. Work up/dn and was able to get them free and
finish perf. Guns stuck again @ 13,630’ work up/dn and was able to get
free. When OOH fd that the port for the bleeder was missing. Will have
magnet on location in the a.m. to try to fish plug OOH. RU to pump.
Break dn perf w/9,150 @ 2 bpm and pump 200 gal of diesel dn well for
freeze protection. SWI. SDFD. (JD)
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2/4/09

2/5/09

2/6/09

Fd 7,000 sicp. RU RIH w/3.5 OD magnet+spang jars on wire line. Tag
plug @ 14,504, set dn gently 3 time and the 3" time stuck tool. Work jars
up/dn several times and got tool free. POOH. When OOH fd metal
shavings, no fish. RU to frac. Pump into perfs w/9,000 @ 2.1 bpm. SD.
ISIP 8,544 FG 1.04 Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick water frac
well w/10,000# 100 mesh, 25,500# 40/70 white sand, 37,500# 40/70
prime plus sand, 2,595 bbls FR slick water, and flushed w/308 bbls FR
slick water. SD. ISIP 8,035 FG 1.0 Average rate 42, average psi 9,600.
Lost pump truck during 1# 40/70 prime plus stage and had to finish job @
37 bpm. SWI. SDFD. (JD) (PME) DC $90,117 CC $9,537,035

Fd 7,000 sicp. RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k magnum bio ball FTFP @
13,680°. Perf stage-8 Lower Mancos IIII £/13,663-67° Break dn perfs
w/8,600 @ 2 bpm. Finish perf {/13,277-81°, 13,354-58°, 13,443-47°,
13,567-71°, 13,606-10°. POOH. Wait on superior to fix computer’s to frac.
Pump into perfs w/8,613 @ 2 bpm. Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick
water frac well w/10,000# 100 mesh sand, 40,000# 40/70 white sand,
60,000%# 40/70 prime plus sand, 3,640 bbls FR slick water, and flushed
w/290 bbls FR slick water. SD. ISIP 7,153 FG .97 FG. Average rate 45
bpm, average psi 8,700. RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k magnum bio ball
FTFP @ 13,126°, Perf stage-9 Lower Macos IIIII £/13,102-06 break dn
perfs w/8,230 @ 2 bpm. Finish perf 1/12,792-94°, 12,825-29°, 12,891-95°,
12,976-80°, 13,054-58’. POOH. RU to frac. Pump into perfs w/7,699 @ 3
bpm. SD. ISIP 6,935 FG .98 FR slick water frac well w/10,000# 100
mesh sand, 40,000# 40/70 white sand, 60,000# 40/70 prime plus sand,
3,041 bbls FR slick water, and flushed w/281 bbls FR slick water.
Dropped 4 bio balls during 1.5# stage, saw good ball action and psi break.
Drop 4 balls during 2# stage, saw good ball action and psi break. SD. ISIP
6,925 FG .98 Average rate 40 bpm, average psi 7,900. RIH w/plug and
guns. Set 10k magnum bio ball FTFP @ 12,620°. Perf stage-10 MN 21
1/12,591-94° Break dn perfs w/7,910 @ 2 bpm. Finish perf 1/12,434-37°,
12,506-09°, 12,549-52°. POOH. SWI. SDFD. (JD)

(PME) DC §$ 271,830 CC $9,808,865

Fd 6,410 sicp. Pump into perfs w/7,351 @ 3 bpm. SD. ISIP 6,621 FG .97
Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick water frac well w/10,000# 100
mesh sand, 40,000%# 40/70 white sand, 60,000# 40/70 prime plus sand,
3,008 bbls FR slick water, and flushed w/274 bbls FR slick water. SD.
ISIP 6,652 FG .98 Average rate 40 bpm, average psi 7,000 RIH w/plug
and guns. Tag something in well head. POOH. Bleed off and break
lubricator. Fd that top slip retainer had broken off. RIH w/4.4 gauge ring
and junk basket, tag @ 300’ and push to 12,000’. POOH. Did not see
anything in junk basket. RIH w/plug and guns. Tag plug part @ 11,000
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2/7/09

2/8/09

push to 11,930’ . Set 10k magnum bio ball FTFP @ 11,930’ Perf stage-
11 Panther 711,900-908°. POOH. RU to frac. Break dn perfs w/6,844 @
3 bpm. Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL acid. FR slick water frac well
w/36,600#40/70 prime plus sand, 1,293 bbls FR slick water, and
flushed w/262 bbls FR slick water. Cut job short due to psi. SD. ISIP
5,989 FG .89 Average rate 41 bpm. Average psi 7,500 RIH w/plug and
guns. Set 10k magnum bio ball FTFP @ 11,760’ Perf stage-12
Aberdeen/Spring canyon {/11,502-05°, 11,570-73°, 11,671-75°, 11,735-
38’. POOH. RU to frac. Break dn perfs w/6,800 @ 3 bpm. Pump 19 bio
ball sealer’s and saw excellent ball action and psi break. SD. ISIP 5,591
FG .92 Surge ball’s off perfs and wait for 10 min. FR slick water frac
well w/4,000# 100 mesh sand, 163,000# 40/70 prime plus sand, 3,605
bbls FR slick water, and flushed w/260 bbls FR slick water. SD. ISIP
5,441 FG .91 Average rate 45 bpm, average psi 7,300. SWI and SDFD.
(JD) (PME) DC $452,438 CC $10,261,303

Fd 5,800 sicp. RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k magnum bio ball FTFP @
11,456’. Perf stage-13 Kenilworth 1/11,288-94°, 11,378-82°, 11,436-38".
POOH. RU to frac. Break dn perfs w/5,254 @ 2 bpm. Pump 21 bio ball
sealer’s, saw good ball action. SD. ISIP 4,366 FG .87. Surge ball’s to pit
and wait for 10 min. FR slick water/linear gel frac well w/43,000#% 100
mesh sand, 180,400# 40/70 prime plus sand, 3,583 bbls FR slick
water/linear gel, and flushed w/247 bbls 2% kcl. SD. ISIP 5,083 FG .89
Average rate 48 bpm, average psi 6,300. Leave well shut in. J&R
construction tie in well head for sales. CTS coil tbg will be on location in
the am. SDFD. (JD) (PME) DC $297,293 CC $10,558,596

MIRU CTS coil tbg. RIH w/3 5/8” Clear cut mill+2 7/8” ECTD even wall
motor+2 7/8” disconnect+2 7/8” jarstMHA disconnect. Holding 4,800 psi
tag plug #1 @ 11,456, drill up and saw O psi inc. RIH. Holding5,700 psi
tag plug #2 @ 11,760, drill up and saw O psi kick. RIH. Holding 6,000 psi
inc tag plug #3 @ 11,930° Drill up and saw 0 psi kick. RIH. Holding
6,500 psi tag plug #4 @ 12,620°, drill up and saw 0 psi kick. RIH. Holding
6,500 psi tag plug #5 @ 13,126’ drill up and saw O psi kick. RIH. Holding
6,500 psi tag plug #6 @ 13,671°, drill up and saw 0 psi kick. RIH. Holding
6,500 because it was all the the well would allow, tag plug #7 @ 14,490°,
drill up and saw 0 psi kick. RIH. Tag sand @ 15,264’ try to wash dn and
stuck pipe. Try to POOH. Had to work up/dn several times pulling over to
get free. POOH. Total depth washed to (15,268’). @ 15,180’ pipe stuck.
Pull up and motor torque up and drilled up hole, pipe free. Hang up @
15,058’ drill free. Hang up @ 14,092’ drill free. Hang up @ 11,288’ could
not drill up through. Open well up to fb to bring psi dn. Psi dn to 5,800,
pull up hole and did not see anything. OOH w/coil tbg. RDMO coil tbg.
Open well up to fb @ 3:23 p.m. w/6,500 on a 14/64 ck. SDFD. (JD)
(PME) DC § CC $
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2/9/09

2/10/09

2/11/09

2/12/09

2/13/09

2/14/09

Final Report

7:00 a.m. 6,000 on a 14/64 ck. Made 956 bbls in 17 hrs 45 min. TR 2,912
bbls, BLWTR 30,805 bbls. Change to a 16/64 ck @ 8:00 am. (JD)
(PME) DC § CC §

7:00 AM, Well flowing w/ 5400 FCP on a 16/64 ck. Made 1,064 bbls in
24 hrs. TR 3,976 bbls, BLWTR 29,741 bbls. 12% recovery. Turn well
over to sales @ 2:15 p.m. w/ 5,200 FCP on two 10/64 ck’s through two
separators. At 2:15 PM, TR 4,255 bbls, BLWTR 29,462. Initial gas rate
3200 MCFD rate. At 7:00 PM, flow rate up to 4537 MCFD rate, 5400
FCP. Pulled choke out of test sep and found it cut out. Shut in flow to test
sep. No repair parts on loc (odd-ball choke). Put flow from test separator
to pit again, for night. Flowing thru 1 sep, on 10/64” ck, and to pit with
10/64” ck at 1137 MCFD rate, for night. (JD)

7:00 AM, 5400 FCP on 10/64 ck to sales (1475 MCFD rate), and 10/64”
ck to pit. Made 737 BW in 16 % hrs. TR 4713. BLWTR 29,004. Sold
total of 458 MCF in 16 % hrs (in addition to split flow going to pit). At
12:15 PM, put test sep back on line w/ 5600 FCP, on 10/64” ck. Initial
flow rate at 5500 FCP w/ 3250 MCFD rate (at 1:45 PM) w/ both seps in
operation, 10/64” in each. (SCE, JD)

7:00 a.m. 5,400 Fcp on two 10/64 ck’s through two separators. Made 470
bbls in 24 hrs, TR 5,183 bbls, BLWTR 28,534 bbls. Gas rate 3,394
Mcf/day. (JD)

7:00 AM, flowing w/ 5000 FCP, on 10/64” ck x 2 (flowing thru 2 test
separators). Made 3387 MCF, 501 BW in 24 hrs. TR 5684. BLWTR
28033. (JD, SCE)

7:00 a.m. 4,400 fcp, on a 10/64 ck through one separator, and a 12/64 ck
through second seperator. Made ck change to bring psi dn to allow
Kennilworth zone to flow. Made 533 bbls in 24 hrs. TR 6,217 bbls,
BLWTR 27,500 bbls, gas rate 3,050 Mcf/day. (JD)
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STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING NATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

ML-47067
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS NA
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing welis below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to G ate Can on
drilt horizontal [aterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. Yy
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
owwetL [ GASWELL [/]  OTHER Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Gasco Production Company 4301332685
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr E, Ste 100 . Englewood srare CO 80112 (303) 483-0044 Gate Canyon
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 1895' FSL & 2007' FWL county: Duchesne
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MeriDiaN: NESW 16 11S  15E STATE: )
UTAH
. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[ acioize [] oeeeen [] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
[¥/1 NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) [] ALTer casine [ FrACTURE TREAT [ sibeTrACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [:] CASING REPAIR D NEW CONSTRUCTION D TEMPORARILY ABANDON
|:| CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D OPERATOR CHANGE [:] TUBING REPAIR
[} cHance TUBING [] rLuc anp ABaNDON [ ventorFare
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT D CHANGE WELL NAME D PLUG BACK D WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)
|:| CHANGE WELL STATUS |:| PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) D WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:
[:] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE 'Zl otHer: EFM Meter
|:| CONVERT WELL TYPE D RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show ali pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

This sundry is being sent to inform you that we will be using a Ferguson Beauregard EFM (Model 3500) to measure
production from this well and will be considered as the point of sale for gas produced from this well. A temperature probe has
been installed for gas measurement purposes. This unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected and proved
according to all regulations.

COPY SENT TO OPERATOR

Date:_2' " 29
Initials: LS

Jessica Berg mme Production Clerk

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)

2/19/2009

DATE

RECEIVED
FEB 23 2008
DIV. OF OlL, GAS & MINING

(5/2000)



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FDENTIAL

FORM 9

5, LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

ML-47067

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

NA

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Gate Canyon

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

1. TYPE OF WELL
o weL [ GAS WELL OTHER Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Gasco Production Company 4301332685
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr E, Ste 100 ., Englewood siare CO 5, 80112 (303) 483-0044 Gate Canyon
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FooTAGES AT SURFACE: 1895’ FSL & 2007' FWL county: Duchesne
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NESW 16 118  15E STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
] acioize [] oeePen [] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
[/1 NoTicE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) [0 Autercasine [ rracture TReat [ sibETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: D CASING REPAIR D NEW CONSTRUCTION D TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[[] cHance To PREVIOUS PLANS [C] operaTOR cHANGE ] tusinG REPAIR
[ cnance TuBING ] PLuG AND ABANDON [] ventorFLare
] sussequenT ReporT [ cHanGE weLL Name ] rueeack [] warerpisposaL
{Submit Original Form Only)
[J cHance weLL sTaTus [/] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [ warersHuT-oFF
Date of work completion:
[0 commingLE PRODUGING FORMATIONS [ ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE O omex
[] convertweLt TvPe ] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

This well was put on production February 10, 2009.

Production Clerk

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) AJesi_ica Berg TITLE
SIGNATURE DATE 2/1 9/2009
(This space for State u&ggp\y) u R E C E HVF- D
Accepted by the -
Utah Division of FEB 23 2009
Mmm
(62000) Oil, Gas and DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING

For Recordse@s"" ons on Revrso Sde)



STATE OF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF Oll, GAS AND MINING
ENTITY ACT‘!O’N FORM
Operator; @00 Production Co Operator Account Number: N 2575
Address: 8 lnverness Dnve East Ste ‘mﬁ
city Englewood
state ©0 zip 80112 Phone Number: w
wel] 1 . ’ . 7
 APINumber , Well Name _QQ | Sec | Twp | Rng |  County
4301332685 Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15 NESW] 16 11 15 Duchesne
~Action Code | Current Entity New E-fitit;y ' Spud Date Entity Aésignmeht
NMumber Number - Effective Date
/ (082 16082 412412007 /70
Comments:
—Ifafrrw’:/m ﬂ%& +o mmbm \ 5//2/07

Well 2 NV
__APINumber __WellName Qa | sec | Twp | Rng County

Current Eriﬁty

- Action Code : ,
_Number |

Number

New Entity

“Spud Date

Comments:
_API Number _WellName | QQ | Sec | Twp | Rng | County

~ NewEntity
' V—Num‘ber 7

Current Entity
Numher

Action Code

- Bpud Date

[Comments:

ACTION CODES;
A - Establish new entity for new well {single well only}
B - Addnew well fo existing entity {group or unit well)
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity
D - Re-assign well from one gxisting éntity 10 @nneweaniiy
E ~ Other (Explain in ‘commenis’ section)

RECEIVED
MAR 1 2 2009

DIV. OF OlL, GAS & MINING

(612000}

Jes}szea Berg

NamePleage Print

§§§n3§ure
Rroduetion C

lerk

A A } &'}\Lﬁ\/’ﬂ\

U 2/2009

ﬁéte



STATE OF UTAH

CONFIDENTIAL

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5, LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

ML-47067
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS NA
Do not use this form fo Is to drill lis, significantly d isting wells bel 1 bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, orto | it O AGREEMENT NAME:
0 not use this form for proposals 10 new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hol epth, reenter plugged wells, or to H
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. o Gate Canyon Unit

1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

~owet [ easwel /] omHER Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Gasco Production Company 4301332685

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

8 Inverness Dr E, Ste 100 Englewood crare CO 5, 80112 (303) 483-0044 Wildcat

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FooTAGES AT surFace: 1895' FSL & 2007' FWL county: Uintah
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NESW 16 11 15 ¢ STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
D NOTICE OF INTENT D D D
(Submit in Duplicate) [ Autercasing ] rracTure TREAT [] sioeTrRAcK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: D CASING REPAIR D NEW CONSTRUCTION ]Z] TEMPORARILY ABANDON

] cHancE To PREVIOUS PLANS ] orerator cHanGE ] tueiNG REPAIR
[] cnancE TUBING [J PLue anp asanpon ] ventorFLaRE

[/l sussequent REPORT ] cHaneE weLL NAME [/] PueBack ] warter DisPosaL

(Submit Original Form Only)
Date of work commlel [ cHaneE wewL sTATUS [[] ProDUCTION (START/RESUME) [J waTter sHut-oFF
ate of work completion:
[[] coMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE O omer:
8/12/2009 [] convertweLL Type [[] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco set a 10K cast iron bridge plug in this well at a depth of 15,273 in order to temporarily abandon production from the
Dakota/Morrison formations. Gasco then dump bailed 9' (8 gal) of cmt on top of the plug changing PBTD to 15,264".

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Matt M

TITLE

Petroleum Engineer

SIGNATURE

DATE k?l/ , g[/ 07

{This space for State use only)

(5/2000)

{See Instructions on Reverse Side)

D
V. OF O, G4g & MiNivA



STATE OF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator: @500 Production Co Operator Account Number: N_2578
Address: 8 Inverness Drive East, Ste 100
city Englewood
state CO zip 80112 Phone Number; _(303) 483-0044
Well 1 : S— —
APINumber | ~_Well Namie o QQ | Sec | Twp | Rng County
4301332686 | Gate Canyon Siate 23-16-11-15 NESW | 16 118 | 15E Duchesne
Action Code ”CUrreht»Enti‘ty New Ent'ityw o Sbud Date Enﬁiy Assighment
|  Number | Number 7 Effective Date
E 16082 NA 412412007 3/31 /09
Comments: . mation Change = MVMCS Wm{}d) 3/ / / 09 c ONglgEh
i
__APINumber | _WellName | QQ | Sec | Twp | Rng |  County
- ActionCode - | Current Entity | NewEntity- - | SpudDate | Entity Assignment
' | Number | _ |  EffectiveDate
Commenfs:
API Number o WellName 0Q | Sec | Twp | Rng |  County
Action Code | Cur;gni Entity 1 NewEntity | Spudpate Entity Assiénment
Mumber . .| . Humber = 1 _ | . EffectiveDate
Comments:
ACTION CODES: , \
A - Establish new entity for new well {single well only) Jesspa Berg
B -~ Add newwell to existing enfity (group or unit welf)
€ - Re-assign well ffom one existing entity to:another existing entity IALTT
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity U

: oduction Clerk —  3/31/2009
RECEIVED Tie Dt
MAR 3 1 2009

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

E - Other(Explain in 'commernis’ section)

{5/2000)



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 8

f tchanges)

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
ML-47067

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

N/A
1a, TYPE OF WELL: oL gas 7] bRy ] pr— 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME
N/A
b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
] . RE- :
AR A I ol Ehrry [ Resvr 1 OTHER Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Gasco Production Company 4301332685
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: /= 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
8 Inverness Drive E, Ste 100 Englewood Co 80112 (303) 483-0044 Wildcat

4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES)
AT SURFACE: 88

11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,
MERIDIAN:

NESW 16 11 15
e el ; o o 12. COUNTY 13. STATE —
G e HaN Yeviei Duschene
14. DATE SPUDDED: 15. DATE T.D, REACHED: | 16, DATE COMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, GL);
412412007 6/1412008 21172009 seatoonen ] reapy To propuce GL: 6817’ KB: 6842
18. TOTALDEPTH: MD 16,610 19. PLUGBACK T.D.: MD |5 768 20. IF MULTIPLE COMPLETIONS, HOW MANY? * | 21. DEPTHBRIDGE  MD 15312
o T olRAH NA PLUGSET: 1312
22. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICAL LOGS RUN (Submit copy of each) 23,
Sonic, STAR, Triple Combo, CBL, CCL, MREX, FLEX Nt wofdl vesf] (swmmanaise
WAS DST RUN? nofZ]  ves[T]  (submit report
DIRECTIONAL SURVEY? no[] ves (Submit copy)
24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in wetl)
HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE | WEIGHT (i) Top D) | BOTTOM(MDy | STACE EEENTER | O ke | voLUME (BeL) | CEMENTTOP** | AMOUNT PULLED
24" H-40 52.5 0 18 redi 100 surface
17 12" H-40 48 0 339 G 320 surface
12 14" L-30 40 0 4,999 G 3.23¢ surface
G 510
778" P-110 23 0 16,603 G 785 Inside Surf
S0poz 1,770
25, TUBING RECORD
SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) | PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) | PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) | PACKER SET (MD)
NA
26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD
FORMATION NAME TOP (WD) | BOTTOM(MD) | TOP (TVD) | BOTTOM (TVD) | INTERVAL (Tap/Bot-MD) | SIZE | NG, HOLES FERFORATION STATUS
»y Morrison 16,446 16,490 open [| Ssaueszed []
® Dakota 15,839 | 16,234 open []  saveozed ]
«© Mancos 11,735 15,264 Open | | Sousezed [
o Mesaverde 11,288 11,908 open [ ] saueszed [ ]

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL

AMOUNT AND TYPE OF MATERIAL

See Attached

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS:

[ eectricaumecranicaL Loes
{1 sunDrY NOTICE FOR PLUGGING AND CEMENT VERIFICATION

D CORE ANALYSIS

2= (
[] ceorosicreport [ ] pstreeort  [] pirecrionaL sté\g 1

3 omer:

30. WELL STATUS:
Ay ehe
.5%1& )‘"7 L.,

AR 07 2003

(512000)

(CONTINUED ON BACK)

DIV, OF OIL, GAS & il



31. INFFIAL PRODUCTION INTERVAL A {As shiown in ftei #26}
DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION [OIL = 8BL: GAS-~MCF:  |WATER-BBL: |PROD.METHOD:
21012609 21512009 24 RATES: = 0 3,821 467 flowing
CHOKE SiZ€: |TBG.PRESS. |CSG.PRESS. JAPIGRAVITY [BTU-GAS GAS/OIL RATIO' {24 HR PRODUCTION JOIL = 8BL: GAS-=MCF:  JWATER-BBL: [INTERVAL STATUS:
15164 4210 RATES: = 0 3,821 467 C&D
INTERVAL B {As shiown in ltsm #26) 7
DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUGTION {OIL —BBL: Joas-MCF:  JWATER-BBL: |PROD.METHOD:
RATES: =
CHOKE SIZE: |TBG.PRESS. [CSG.PRESS: JAPIGRAVITY [BTU-GAS ~ [GAS/OIL RATIO J24 HR PRODUCTION jon. - BBL: GAS~MCF:  JWATER ~BBL: lm‘n_snvm. STATUS:
RATES: ~
INTERVAL C {As shown in Ham #26)
DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION fou. -~ BRL: GAS — MCF: lwmea ~BBLY lmou METHOD:
RATES: =
CHOKE SIZE: | THG. PRESS. lcse PRESS.  [APIGRAVITY raw ~GAS GASIOILRATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION JOIL ~8BL; GAS ~MCF:.  |WATER-BBL: IINTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: —
INTERVAL D (A% ehown In itém #26)
DATE FIRST PRODUGED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION |k - BBL: [6AS—MCF:  |WATER~BBL: [PROD.METHOD:
RATES: =+
CHOKE SIZE: |TBG.PRESS. JCSG.PRESS. [APIGRAVITY Iew— GAS GAS/OIL RATIO. §24 HR PROBUCTION Joi ~BBL: GAS—MCF:  |WATER-BBL: rnmvm. STATUS:
RATES: —
32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sofd, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc)
33. SUMMARY OF POROUS zdus’s,(mcmde Aquifers): 34. FORMATION (Log) MARKERS:
Show all tmportant rid its therdof: Cored intervals and all ditll-stsm tasts, ncluding depth interval
tested, cushionused, tms toc!open flowing-and shutin pressures and recaveties.
; Top Bottoin s . i, ic. B TFop
Formation. D) D) Descriptions; Contens, &fc. Name (Meqsﬂ red'Beﬁm)
Wasatch 3686 [ 7876
Mesaverde 7,876 11,681
Mancos 11,681 15,868
Dakota 15,868 16,372
Morrison 16,372 16,610 | Well TD'd within the Morrison
35. ADDITIONAL REMARKS (Include plugging procedure}
36. Vhereby certify going and et p ¢ as ined from-

TITLE Petro‘leum Eﬂgineer

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Matt OS’AQS

SIGNA'RJRE

oare 31072009

This report must be submitted within 30 days of

o completing or plugging anew well
» drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore
& recompleting to a different producing formation

*{TEM 20: Show the number of campletions if praductiorn is measiired separately from two or more formations.

® reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well

* significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth

o drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples-and stratigraphic tests

**|TEM 24: Germent Top — Show how reported top(s) of cement were defermined (circulated (CIR), caloutated (CAL), cement bondlog (CBL), temperature survey (TS)):

Sendto:  Utah Division of Oll, Gas and Mining
’ 1594 West North Temple, Suile 1210

Box 145801

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

{§2000)

Phonea: 801-538-5340
Fax: 801-359-3940



Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-135
Additional Information to Well Completion Report

27. Perforation Record

Perforated Interval Size No.Holes | Perf_Stams
16446-54; 16486-90 0.38 42 Open
16224-34 0.38 30 Open
16112-22 0.38 30 Open
15839-43; 15869-73; 15912-16 0.38 36 Open_
14995-99; 15058-62; 15087-91; 15157-61; 15180-84; 15238-42; 15260-64 0.38 84 Open
14550-54; 14601-05; 14743-47; 14771-75; 14822-26; 14916-20 . ). 72 Open.
14092-96; 14252-56; 14342-46; 4365-69 3433-37; 14475-19 .3 ~ 12 Open
13277-81; 13354-58; 13443-47; 3567-11; 13606~ 6:_ 3663-67 . ), 12 Open
12702-96; 12825-29; 12891-95: 12976-80; 13054-58; 13102-06 ). 72 Open
12434-37; 12506-09; 12549-52; 12591-94 - ).3 36 ._Open .
11900-08 403 48 Open
11502-05; 11570-73; 11671-15; 11735-38 3 D.38 39 Open
11288-94; 11378-82: 11436-38 0.38 36 Open_
28. Acid Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc (continued) .
Depth Interval Amount and Type of Material
16446-16490 Hybrid frac well w/5,000# 100 mesh, 70,0004 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,518 bbis 30# XL.-BHT gel
16224-16234 Hybrid frac well w/5,000% 100 mesh; 85,0004 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,648 bbls.30# XL.-BHT gel
16112-16122 {beﬁd frac well w/5,000# 100 mesh, 75,000% 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,849 bbls 30# XI.-BHT gel.
15839-15916 Hybrid frac well wiS,000# 100 mesh, 65,0004 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,2 :
14995-15264 Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick water/linear gel frac well w/68.700# PRC 6000 premium 40/70 sand, 4,500.bbls.
4550-14920 Pump 1,000 gal 7.5%! HCL FR sllck water/lmear el frac well w/81,000# PR 6000 premium 40/70 sand, 5,320 bbls .
4092-14479 Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% - : 3 ~
3277-13667 Purmp 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL FR stick water irac weil w/10,000# 1
12792-13106 FR slickwater frac well w/10,000% 100 mesh sand; 40,0004 40/70 white sand.
2434-12594 Pum ___p 1,000 gg_lg 5% HCL. FR stick water frac well w/10,000# 100 mesh sand. 40,000% 40/70 whlte sand, 60,0004 40/70 prime plus sand, 3,008 bbls
11900-1190 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL acid. FR slick wate frac well w/36,600#40/70.prime plus, 1,203 bbls FR slick water
1502-1173 FR slick water frac well w/4,000# 100 mesh sand, 163,0004 40/70 prime:plus 3,605 bbls: FR slick water

11288-11438 FR slick water/linear gel frac well w/43,000# 160.mesh sand, 180, 400# 40770 prime plus sand. 3 583 bbis
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Gasco Production

GCS 23-16-11-15
Uintah County, Utah
Final Completion Report

Denver,
RS

\iﬂ- 3

torade

Bighorn Directional, Inc.

Page: 1

Minimum of Curvature
Slot Location: 1895.00', 2007.00°
Plane of Vertical Section: 180.00°

Measured BORE HOLE

Depth Inc Direction

Feet Degrees  Degrees
0.00 0.00 0.00
469.00 4.40 252.90
658.00 4.00 245.90
1065.00 1.90 240.90
1517.00 1.60 233.60
1969.00 1.50 219.00
2472.00 1.20 212.50
2949.00 2.00 210.20
3516.00 3.30 207.90
3995.00 7.10 201.90
4091.00 7.90 203.80
4183.00 8.20 201.10
4279.00 7.70 201.10
4375.00 7.90 204.90
4754.00 14.60 204.30
4787.00 15.20 201.50
4850.00 16.50 205.70
4943.00 16.30 203.30

CSG SHOE

5027.00 16.30 203.00
5056.00 16.10 208.00
5080.00 15.70 211.00
5216.00 14.50 198.00
5307.00 13.30 206.00
5400.00 12.70 211.00
5497.00 11.40 206.00
5592.00 10.40 206.00

True
Vertical
Depth
Feet

0.00
468.54
657.03

1063.47
1515.26

1967.10
2469.96
2946.77
3513.15
3990.09

4085.27
4176.36
4271.44
4366.55
4738.06

4769.95
4830.56
4919.77

5000.40
5028.25

5051.33
5182.67
5271.01
5361.63
5456.49

5549.78

RECTANGULAR
COORDINATES
North(-South) East(-West)

Feet

0.00
-5.29
-10.12
-19.19
-26.58

-34.93
-44.48
-55.89
-78.87
-118.53

-130.07
-141.98
-154.37
-166.35
-233.59

-241.40
-257.15
-281.04

-302.71
-310.01

-315.73
-347.71
-367.95
-386.33
-404.09

-420.23

Feet

0.00
-17.20
-30.15
-49.01
-60.63

-69.43
-76.41
-83.28
-95.89
-113.39

-118.27
-123.18
-127.96
-133.05
-163.71

-167.01
-173.92
-184.81

-194.07
-197.55

-200.79
-215.53
-223.64
-233.59
-243.29

-251.16

RECTANGULAR
COORDINATES
FSL FwWL
Feet Feet
1895.00 2007.00
1889.71 1989.80
1884.88 1976.85
1875.81 1957.99
1868.42 1946.37
1860.07 1937.57
1850.52 1930.59
1839.11 1923.72
1816.13 1911.11
1776.47 1893.61
1764.93 1888.73
1753.02 1883.82
1740.63 1879.04
1728.65 1873.95
1661.41 1843.29
1653.60 1839.99
1637.85 1833.08
1613.96 1822.19
1592.29 1812.93
1584.99 1809.45
1579.27 1806.21
1547.29 1791.47
1527.05 1783.36
1508.67 1773.41
1490.91 1763.71
1474.77 1755.84

Vertical
Section
Feet

0.00
5.29
10.12
19.19
26.58

34.93
44.48
55.89
78.87
118.53

130.07
141.98
154.37
166.35
233.59

241.40
257.15
281.04

302.71
310.01

315.73
347.71
367.95
386.33
404.09

420.23

CLOSURES
Distance Direction

Feet Deg
0.00 0.00
18.00 252.90
3180 25145
52.63 248.61
66.20 246.33
7772 243.30
88.41 239.79
100.30 236.13
12416 230.56
164.03 223.73
175.80 222.28
187.97 220.94
200.51 219.66
213.02 218.65
285.24 215.03
293.54 214.68
31044 214.07
336.35 213.33
359.58 212.66
367.60 212.51
37417 21245
409.09 211.79
430.59 211.29
45146 211.16
471.68 211.05
489.57 210.87

Dogleg
Severity
Deg/100'

0.00
0.94
0.34
0.52
0.08

0.09
0.07
0.17
0.23
0.80

0.87
0.52
0.52
0.58
1.77

2.84
2.75
0.76

0.10
4.86

3.81
2.64
249
1.37
1.72

1.05




Gasco Production
GCS 23-16-11-15
Uintah County, Utah

Final Completion Report

Bighorn Directional, Inc.

Page: 2

Minimum of Curvature
Slot Location: 1895.00', 2007.00'
Plane of Vertical Section: 180.00°

Measured
Depth
Feet

5689.00
5786.00
5879.00
5980.00
6075.00

6171.00
6267.00
6362.00
6454.00
6549.00

6741.00
6840.00
6934.00
7032.00
7127.00

7223.00
7980.00
8076.00
8172.00
8268.00

8367.00
8461.00
8557.00
8647.00
8742.00

8842.00
8938.00

BORE
Inc
Degrees

9.50
8.70
8.20
7.80
7.10

7.20
6.80
6.30
5.90
5.50

5.30
5.20
5.10
5.10
5.10

5.30
5.40
5.80
5.20
6.30

6.80
7.10
7.60
7.60
7.80

8.40
8.90

HOLE

Direction

Degrees

210.00
204.00
208.00
209.00
206.00

210.00
209.00
212.00
212.00
211.00

212.00
208.00
208.00
204.00
203.00

207.00
200.00
198.00
193.00
203.00

200.00
204.00
196.00
201.00
199.00

195.00
192.00

True
Vertical
Depth
Feet

5645.32
5741.10
5833.09
5933.11
6027.31

6122.56
6217.84
6312.22
6403.70
6498.23

6689.38
6787.97
6881.59
6979.20
7073.82

7169.43
7923.14
8018.68
8114.24
8209.76

8308.11
8401.42
8496.63
8585.84
8679.99

8778.99
8873.90

RECTANGULAR
COORDINATES
North(-South) East(-West)

Feet

-435.04
-448.67
-460.95
-473.31
-484.22

-494.76
-504.95
-514.28
-522.58
-530.62

-546.03
-553.86
-561.31
-569.14
-576.88

-584.76
-649.39
-658.24
-667.10
-676.18

-686.69
-697.23
-708.75
-720.03
-731.99

-745.46
-759.50

Feet

-259.01
-265.99
-271.97
-278.67
-284.37

-289.98
-295.74
-301.23
-306.41
-311.34

-320.78
-325.31
-329.27
-333.09
-336.46

-340.14

-368.19
-371.24
-373.71
-376.75

-380.88
-385.14
-389.31
-393.08
-397.43

-401.53
-404.89

RECTANGULAR
COORDINATES
FSL FwL
Feet Feet
1459.96 1747.99
1446.33 1741.01
1434.05 1735.03
1421.69 1728.33
1410.78 1722.63
1400.24 1717.02
1390.05 1711.26
1380.72 1705.77
1372.42 1700.59
1364.38 1695.66
1348.97 1686.22
1341.14 1681.69
1333.69 1677.73
1325.86 1673.91
1318.12 1670.54
1310.24 1666.86
1245.61 1638.81
1236.76 1635.76
1227.90 1633.29
1218.82 1630.25
1208.31 1626.12
1197.77 1621.86
1186.25 1617.69
1174.97 1613.92
1163.01 1609.57
1149.54 1605.47
1135.50 1602.11

Vertical
Section
Feet

435.04
448.67
460.95
473.31
484.22

494.76
504.95
514.28
522.58
530.62

546.03
553.86
561.31
569.14
576.88

584.76
649.39
658.24
667.10
676.18

686.69
697.23
708.75
720.03
731.99

745.46
759.50

CLOSURES
Distance Direction

Feet Deg

506.30 210.77
52159 210.66
535.20 210.54
549.25 210.49
561.55 21042
573.48 210.37
585.18 210.36
596.01 210.36
605.78 210.39
61522 210.40
633.28 21043
642.33 210.43
650.76 210.40
65945 210.34
667.83 210.25
676.49 210.19
746.50 209.55
755.71  209.42
764.64 209.26
774.06 209.13
785.25 209.02
796.53 208.92
808.63 208.78
820.34 208.63
832.92 208.50
846.72 208.31
860.68 208.06

Dogleg
Severity
Deg/100

1.17
1.28
0.83
0.42
0.84

0.53
0.44
0.64
0.43
043

0.12
0.38
0.11
0.36
0.09

0.43
0.09
0.46
0.80
1.55

0.61
0.61
1.19
0.73
0.35

0.82
0.70




Gasco Production
GCS 23-16-11-15
Uintah County, Utah

Final Completion Report

Oanyer. Colorado
EEVE T

Bighorn Directional, Inc.

Page: 3

Minimum of Curvature
Slot Location: 1895.00', 2007.00’
Plane of Vertical Section: 180.00°

Measured BORE

Depth Inc
Feet Degrees
9113.00 9.50
9204.00 9.90
9305.00 10.00
9398.00 10.30
9491.00 10.20
9587.00 9.90
9685.00 10.10
9874.00 9.70
9959.00 9.00

10055.00 8.60

10254.00 7.00

10345.00 6.40

10533.00 6.50

10694.00 6.10

10819.00 5.00

10915.00 5.60

11011.00 5.20

11103.00 4.60

11198.00 4.40

As Drilled 4-29-08

11324.00 4.30

11419.00 4.90

11515.00 5.50

11707.00 6.20

11898.00 5.60

11994.00 5.50

12186.00 5.50

HOLE

Direction

Degrees

196.00
195.00
191.00
194.00
192.00

192.00
193.00
192.00
199.00
198.40

198.40
193.40
192.40
181.00
190.40

184.40
182.40
207.00
211.00

191.00

186.40
187.00
195.00
189.00
187.00

189.40

True
Vertical
Depth
Feet

9046.65
9136.35
9235.83
9327.37
9418.89

9513.42
9609.93
9796.11
9879.99
9974.86

10172.01
10262.39
10449.20
10609.23
10733.65

10829.23
10924.81
11016.48
11111.19

11236.83

11331.53
11427.13
11618.13
11808.12
11903.67

12094.79

RECTANGULAR
COORDINATES
North(-South) East(-West)

Feet

-786.62
-801.40
-818.39
-834.39
-850.51

-866.89
-883.51
-915.23
-928.52
-942.43

-968.06
-978.25
-998.84
-1016.29
-1028.29

-1037.08
-1046.09
-1053.55
-1060.06

-1068.84

-1076.37
-1085.01
-1104.16
-1123.33
-1132.52

-1150.73

Feet

-411.68
-415.78
-419.70
-423.25
-426.97

-430.46
-434.14
-441.18
-444.83
-449.54

-458.07
-460.99
-465.71
-467.81
-468.91

-470.03
-470.57
-472.42
-476.03

-479.42

-480.55
-481.57
-485.37
-489.50
-490.79

-493.42

RECTANGULAR
COORDINATES
FSL FWL
Feet Feet
1108.38 1595.32
1093.60 1591.22
1076.61 1587.30
1060.61 1583.75
1044.49 1580.03
1028.11 1576.54
1011.49 1572.86
979.77 1565.82
966.48 1562.17
952.57 1557.46
926.94 1548.93
916.75 1546.01
896.16 1541.29
878.71 1539.19
866.71 1538.09
857.92 1536.97
848.91 1536.43
841.45 1534.58
834.94 1530.97
826.16 1527.58
818.63 1526.45
809.99 1525.43
790.84 1521.63
771.67 1517.50
762.48 1516.21
744.27 1513.58

Vertical
Section
Feet

786.62
801.40
818.39
834.39
850.51

866.89
883.51
915.23
928.52
942.43

968.06
978.25
998.84
1016.29
1028.29

1037.08
1046.09
1053.55
1060.06

1068.84

1076.37
1085.01
1104.16
1123.33
1132.52

1150.73

CLOSURES
Distance Direction
Feet Deg
887.84 207.63
902.83 207.42
919.74 207.15
935.60 206.90
951.67 206.66
967.88 206.41
984.41 206.17
1016.01 205.74
1020.58 205.60
1044.16  205.50
1070.96  205.32
1081.43 205.23
1102.07 205.00
1118.79 204.72
1130.16  204.51
1138.62 204.38
1147.06 204.22
1154.62 204.15
1162.04 204.18
1171.44  204.16
1178.77 204.06
1187.08 203.93
1206.13  203.73
122535 203.55
123429 203.43
1252.06 203.21

Dogleg
Severity
Deg/100'

0.50
0.48
0.69
0.65
0.40

0.31
0.27
0.23
1.57
0.43

0.80
0.92
0.08
0.81
1.14

0.85
0.46
2.35
0.39

1.20

0.74
0.63
0.56
0.45
0.23

0.12




Gasco Production

GCS 23-16-11-15
Uintah County, Utah
Final Completion Report

Bighorn Directional, Inc.

, Col
WY

\g“.

Page: 4

Minimum of Curvature
Slot Location: 1895.00', 2007.00'
Plane of Vertical Section: 180.00°

Measured BORE HOLE

Depth Inc Direction
Feet Degrees Degrees
12377.00 5.70 205.00
12568.00 5.80 202.00
12759.00 5.90 192.00
As Drilled 4-30-08
12951.00 6.20 213.40
13143.00 6.10 189.40
13334.00 6.10 188.00
13545.00 6.50 195.00
14069.00 5.70 185.00
14574.00 5.60 182.00
As Drilled 5-17-08
14858.00 5.10 180.00
15241.00 5.20 180.00
16077.00 3.60 162.10
As Drilled 6-11-08
16595.00 3.40 173.50

Final Station Closure Distance: 1632.54'

True RECTANGULAR
Vertical COORDINATES
Depth North(-South) East(-West)

Feet Feet Feet

12284.89 -1168.36 -498.92

12474.93 -1185.90 -506.54

12664.94 -1204.45 -512.20

12855.89 -1222.77 -519.96

13046.82 -1241.49 -527.33

13236.74 -1261.55 -530.40

13446.47 -1284.19 -535.06

13967.51 -1338.76 -545.00

14470.06 -1388.37 -548.05

14752.82 -1414.84 -548.53

15134.27 -1449.22 -548.53

15967.82 -1512.09 -540.46

16484.86 -1542.83 -533.72

Direction: 199.08°

RECTANGULAR
COORDINATES
FSL FwL
Feet Feet
726.64 1508.08
709.10 1500.46
690.55 1494.80
672.23 1487.04
653.51 1479.67
633.45 1476.60
610.81 1471.94
556.24 1462.00
506.63 1458.95
480.16 1458.47
445.78 1458.47
382.91 1466.54
352.17 1473.28

Vertical
Section
Feet

1168.36
1185.90
1204.45

1222.77
1241.49

1261.55
1284.19
1338.76
1388.37
1414.84

1449.22
1512.09

1542.83

CLOSURES
Distance Direction
Feet Deg
127043 203.12
1289.56 203.13
1308.84 203.04
1328.73  203.04
1348.84 203.01
1368.52 202.80
1391.19 202.62
144544 202.15
149262 201.54
1517.45 201.19
154956 200.73
1605.77 199.67
1632.54 199.08

Dogleg
Severity
Deg/100'

0.80
0.17
0.54

1.18
1.33

0.08
0.41
0.25
0.06
0.19

0.03
0.25

0.14




LEASE: ML-47067 WELL #:
MLgT067 0000 d Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15
FIELD: Wildeal
LOCATION: 1895 FSL & 2007 FWL N
COUNTY: Duchesne — APE 43-013-32685
‘ CONDUCTOR T T o8IT
SIZE. 13 38" { KB: 5837
WT/GRD: ) SPUD DATE: ~ W/172007 |
CW;IZGRD: - & j COMP DATE: ~JTOI00V |
S$X: TIx 2% Cakl;
CIRC: Y
TOC: - Sat______ DATE FIRST PRODUCED
HOLE SIZE: T PRODUCTIONMETHOD ~— fow
CHOKE SIZE
SURFACE CASING Csg PRESSURE
SIZE: 95/3" OIL (BBL)
WT/GRD: - _L®™ GAS (M -
ngTAIGRD: 0% WATER (BBL) —ev
3 59
sX: 30 Clan G 3
CIRC: om YA e
;ch:E — Suf No TBG (2/9/09)
PRODUCTION CASING
SIZE: 512
WT/GRD: =
WT/GRD: pEl)
CSA: 6,603
SX: TR sx Class
CIRC: s
TOC: Tnside Surl
HOLE SIZE: T
Stimwlgtion
13: FR stick water/linear gel frac well
s”"mm w/43,000% 100 mesh sand, 180,400¢ B 2584 Stage 13 - Keailworth
40770 prime plus sand, 3,583 bbls =k 11378-82 11436-38 Stage 13 - Kenilworth
FR slick
Seagerz; |TR "'::Jﬁ;;‘" ""xﬂ: ;I‘: el 11302-05 11570-73 Stage 12 - Aberdeen
2/6/2009 m"“i‘ ;". m“* e d‘:k"’ = 1167175 11735-38 Stage 12 - Spring Canyon
Stage 11; |7 1000 g2l 7.5% HCL acid. FR slick =r  11900-08 StaselllRastiey
/2000 | Water frac well wi36,600640/70 prime
plus, 1,293 bbls FR slick water
Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick water == 12434-37 12506-09 Stage 10 - MN21
Stage 10: |2 well wﬂ?.lm 100 mesh amd‘ = 12549-52 1259194 Siaeci ORI
m 40,0002 40/70 white sand, 60,0008 4070
prime plus sand, 3,008 bbls = 12792-96 12825-29 Stage 9 - Mances
FR slickwaser w/10,0008 ke 12891-95 12976-80 Stage 9 - Mances
sf.;:s\: wf;‘“"ﬂm;m '°°! et=  13034-58 1310206 Stage 9 - Maaces
' 60,0004 40/70 pnme plus, 3,041 bbls
Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick wat ke 13277-81 13354-58 Stage 8 - Mancos
. ~ frac well w!l?'m 100 " cl i f=p= 1344347 13567-71 Stage 8 - Mancos
tage 8: = pmls  13606-10 13663-67 Stage 8 - Mancos
2752009 [40.000% 40770 white sand, 60,0004 40/70
prime plus sand, 3,640 bbls
Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick water|
Stmpe7s |TC Well WI10,0008 100 mesh, 25,500 =y 19002;06114252,56 Stage i vimnces
e T 0 |40/70 white sand, 37,5008 40170 prime Ry AAZACIAS 65,69, e aaces
2/472009 B e pri le  14433-37 14475-79 Stage 7 - Mances
1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR oli
Sages: [0 1090 S eI 14550-54 14601-05 Stage 6 - Mancos
12572009 6000 o 1474347 14771-78 Stage 6 - Mancos
premium 40/70 sand, 5,320 bbis 1482226 14916-20 Stage 6 - Mancos
Stages: |PUP 1000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick
: terflinear gel frac well w/68,700# PRC ;
172572009 ** ; . ke 14995-99 15058-62 Stage 5 - Mances
5000 premium 40/70 sand, 4.590 bbis =f= 1508791 1515761 Stage § - Mances
Stage 4 [Hiybrid frac well w/S,0004 100 mesh :‘- 15180-84 1523842 15260-64 Stage 5 - Mancos
ge 4
11/13/2008 |63.000% 18/40 Vena prop sand, 1,200 : DS ill (@) 13.268° (272/2009)
bbls XL BHT gel 4 IL":NK Magnum Aluminum BPa 15312' (1222009)
- : 10K Cast Irem FTFP@ 15,320' (1/26/2009)
Sll;f.'k :'mﬁl‘:/fé:::’:: 100 ":‘“h’ ; | __Top of Fish (@ 15.915' (15/2009)(Coil TBG BHA)
472008] | 15839-43 15869-73 Stage 4 - Dakota Silt
[bbls 30# XL-BHT gel == 15912-16 Stage 4 - Dakota Silt
Stage 2: Hybrid fiac well wiS 0008 100 sash, . 10K Alag FTFPr 15,950° (1 1/152008)
10302005 550008 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1648 | L 161220 Stage 3 - Dakota
[bbis 30# XL-BHT gel i 10K M. FIFPw 16148 (11/1472008)
=t 16224-34 Stape 2 - Dakota
Stage 13 :‘o""""’ f';':u‘;"“l""s-m 100 “S':-. ¥ 10K Magnlies FTFP @ 18,256" (103072008
10/26/72008 0004 ‘ersa prop sand, b | 5446-54 Seage 1 - Merrison
[bbls 308 XL-BHT gel [ ef= 1648690 Stage 1 - Morrison
Preparad Rrvriod bv [ e ra i ] JIEs 1
MRO 211y
MD_16,610 PBTD @ 15.268' (2/8/2009
™ TS !




~ STATEOFUTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM9

S ey e Ty or e
6. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL-NUMBER:

ML-47067

SUNDRY NOTICES ANb REPORTS ON WELLS

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

NA
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not.use this form for praposals 1o drill néw wells, significantly deepan existing wells bistaw cuirent bottom-hiote depth, roariter plugged wells, or o Gate Can on
drill horizontal tatersls. Uss APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. y
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER: _

oweLll [ GASWELL 7]  OTHER

Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15

eov———————
2. NAME OF OPERATOR:

S APINUMBER:

Gasco Production Company 4301332685
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: o PHONE NUMBER: _ 70, FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT;
8lnvemess DrE, Ste 100, . Englewood e CO 80112 {303) 483-0044 Gate Canyon

4. LOCATION-OF WELL

FOOTAGES ATSURFACE: 1895' FSL & 2007' FWL

county: Duchésne

QTRIOTR, SECTION, TownsHie, Rance; mERDIe NESW 16 118 1BE STATE: OTAH
1, CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION | _ TYPE OF ACTION .
[0 wonceor nNrenr [ Acioize [ oeeren [[] RrererrFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
{Subritin Duplicata) ] auvercasing [ eracture TReaT [] sibetrack TO REPAIRWELL
Approximate dateworkwitster:  [[7] casingRePAR ' FRUCTION [} vewroRsmY AaNDON
/2 L/ 09 ,  (Cance [] tueicrerar

4] sussequenTre

{Submit Qriginal Fou
i . 1 (START/RESLME)
Date of work.complatiot .
o N OF WELL SITE
M } - DIFFERENT FORMATION

[ venvorFLARE

[j WATER DISPOSAL

[ warerskut-oFF

7] omer: Correct Direction
Drilling Discrepency

12, DESCRIBE PROPOS

Gasco did not use
dip of the formatior,

Hing dates, depths, volumes, ete:

naturally upon drilling operations due 1o the regional
ited in any way by operations performed by Gasco.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) MW me _Petroleum Engineer

SIGNATURE il oate  422/2009
yaN
(This space for State use only} R EC E IVE D
- APR2:2 2009

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING




, STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM'9

[P ————————————————————————t
5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIALNUMBER:

ML-47067

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do notuse thils form for proposals o diill néw wells, significanily deepen existing wells bistaw current bottomn-hole depth, reenter pluggsd welis, of to
drift horizonta) laterals. ‘Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
NA

7. UNIT or CAAGREEMENT NAME:
Gate Canyon

1. TYPE OF WELL

orwerl [ GAS WELL " OTHER

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER!

Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15

rm————
2. NAME OF OPERATOR:

9. APINUMBER:

Gasco Production Company 4301332685
3, ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: — PHONE NUMBER: _ 70, FIELD AND. POOL, OR WILDCAT:
8Invemaess OrE, Ste 100 . Englewood ceare CO . 80112 {303) 483-0044 Gate Canyon
4 LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES ATSURFAGE: 1895’ FSL. & 2007' FWL county: Duchesne
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RanGe, MerDisn: NESW 16 118 15E STATE: UTAH
11, CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT. OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION . - TYPE OF ACTION _
[] womce oF INTent ] acwioize [[] oseeen [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
{Subiritin Duplicata) ] aurercasing [0} rFracture TrREAT [[] siweTRACK TOREFAIRWELL
Approximate dateworkwii start:  [[™] CASING REPAIR [] mewconsTrRuCTON [ veMPORARILY ABANDON
[/] CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [[] oreraToR CHANGE [ vuemererair
[] cuance Tusme [ ruieanp Asanpon [[] venvorFLaRe
/] sussequentRePORT [ cHanceweLL NaME ] russack ] warer oisposaL
{Submit Originat Form Only} ,
tn ik g [[] cHanee weL sTaTus [[] rrobucTion (STARFIRESUME) [} warer srur-oFF
v [[] commncLe PRODUCING FORMATIONS ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE 7] omir: Cortect Direction
6/14/2008 [ converrwew Tvre * [[] RecoMeLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Drilling Discrepency

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details inciding dates, depths, volumes; efe.

Gasco did not use tools to directionally drill this wellbore. The well drifted naturally upon drilling operations due to the regional
dip of the formation beds. The resulting bottom hole location was not dictated in any way by operations performed by Gasco.

TILE

Petroleum Engineer

NAME (FLEASE PRINT) MatW

SIGNATURE

4/22/2009

DATE

{This space for State use only)

{5/2000) {See(nstructions on Reverse Side)

RECEIVED

- APR:2'2 2009
DIV.OF OIL, GAS & MINING
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Page 1 of 1

Helen Sadik-Macdonald - Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15

T T T T S L e s e

From: "Matt Owens"

To: "Helen Sadik-Macdonald"
Date: 4/22/2009 4:01 PM

Subject: Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15

Attachments:

Helen, here is a sundry stating that no direction drilling operations took place; the well was left to drift naturally
during drilling operations. | have also included a map that shows all Gasco acreage in yellow. There is a one
mile radius circle drawn around the bottom hole location showing we own ali leases within a one mile radius. Let
me know if this is not sufficient.

Thank you,
Matt Owens
Petroleum Engineer

Gasco Energy INC
303-996-1839

file://C:\Documents and Settings\ogmuser\Local Settings\Temp\XPgrpwise\49OEF3F70N...  04/22/2009



GASCO Energy, inc.
8 Inverness Drive East
Suite 100

Englewood, CO 80112
(303) 483-0044
www.gascoenergy.com

GASCO
Fnergy Inc

May 8, 2009

Helen Sadik-Macdonald, CPG
Engineering Geologist

Utah Div. of Oil, Gas & Mining
PO Box 145801

Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Re: Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15 Well
Township 11 South, Range 15 East
Section 16; NE¥4SWY4

Ms. Sadik-Macdonald:

Pursuant to our recent telephone conversations and emails regarding the above
referenced well, Gasco Production Company (“Gasco”) provides the following
information and discussion.

This Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15 Well (the “Well") was not drilled with direction
steering tools and was allowed to drift naturally during the drilling process. As a resuilt,
the bottom hole location is approximately 1,543’ to the south and 534’ to the west of the
surface location. This well reached an approximate total depth of 16,610".

The State of Utah School and Institutional Trust Lands Administration owns the surface
and 100% of the minerals under both Section 16 as well as Sections 20 and 21. Gasco
along with XTO Energy (who participated in the Well), owns the oil and gas lease
covering all of Section 16. Gasco owns 100% of the oil and gas leases covering
Sections 20 and 21. The leases and lands in Sections 16, 20, and 21 are all held by
actual production. Copies of the leases will be supplied upon your request. A plat of
mineral and leasehold ownership is attached hereto.

As the mineral ownership in Sections 16 and 21 are identical, there should be no issue

regarding any potential for drainage; i.e. the State of Utah cannot be harmed. Nor will
any adjacent stake holders be harmed as there none.
RECEIVED

MAY 0 8 2009
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



I hope this fully addresses any issues you may have with this well. In future, Gasco will
take the necessary efforts to keep its wells within the drilling window. If you have further
questions or need additional information please let me know.

Petroleum Engineer
GASCO Energy, Inc.
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GASCO
Energy

May 12, 2009

Mr. Shannon Nichols
XTO Energy

810 Houston Street
Fort Worth, TX 76102

Via Email: Shannon_nichols@xtoenergy.com and U.S. Mail

RE: Exception Location Request
Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15
ip 11 South, Range 15 East, SLM
Section 16: NEV.SWY.
Uintah County, Utah

Dear Mr. Nichols:

Pursuant to Rule 649-3-2 of UDOGM Rules and Regulations, Gasco Production Company
(*Gasco”) hereby requests that you provide written consent to an exception location for the
captioned well, as your ownership falls within a 460 foot radius of the proposed well location.
Gasco owns all other working/leasehold rights on these 100% SITLA owned minerals.

Gasco drilled and XTO participated in this well and it was allowed to drift outside of the legal
window.

Attached is a copy of the survey plat for the well.

Please indicate your acceptance by signing a copy of this letter and returning it to me. A
scanned copy will be sufficient.

Your prompt response is greatly appreciated.

David Smith
Manger, Land and Regulatory Affairs

AGREED TO AND ACCEPTED THIS “-H" DAY OF May, 2009
XTO Energy

%MM

G "O ’?*ffmumsﬂn Company Tef 13031 483-0042
East Suite 160 303) 4836011
L0 B12.5628 Email demihddorscoenerngy.com
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STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

[———————— e e—
5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

ML-47067

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do notusé this form for proposals to drill new wets, significantly despen existing weils below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizorital laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such propasals.

mvetre——————
6, IFINDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

NA

R Ty
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Gate Canyon

1. TYPE OF WELL

8, WELL NAME and NUMBER:

oLwel [J  casweLL OTHER Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15
7. NAME OF OPERATOR: 5. AFI NUMBER:
Gasco Production Company 4301332685
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
8lnvermess DrE, Ste 100. . . Englewood s GO, 80112 (303) 483-0044 Gate Canyon
4. LOCATION OF WELL
rooTages ATSURFACE: 1895' FSL & 2007 FWL county: Duchesne
QTRIOTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NESW 16 11§ 15E STATE: UTAR
1, CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION _ TYPE OF ACTION .
NOTICE OF INTENT [ acoize [[] oeeren [] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

{Submit in Duplicate)
Approximate date work will start:

[ arercasine
[] casineReraR
CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS
[ onencevueme

1 sracTuRE TREAT

] newconstrucTion
[[] operavor cHanee
] erucano asanoon

[0 sueseauenTrePoRT  {[[] crancewewL Nave [ ruesack
(Subit Original Form Only)
[} cranceweLL STATUS - [[] eroDUCTION (STARTIRESUME)
Date of wark complation:

] commmeLe PRODUCIG FORMATIONS
[ converrweis Tvee

1 RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE
[} recoMPLETE - BIFFERENT FORMATION

[[] simetrack 7o REPAIR WELL
[[] vemrorariLy Asanoon
] rusmarerar

[ venrorruare

[[] warerpisPosaL

] wamersuut-ore

] omer: Request Exception
Location

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS, Clearly show all partinent details including dates, depths, volumes, stc.
Gasco Production Company would like to request an exception location because the well drifted out of tolerance and state

stake holders were notified and agreeable as per this signed attachment.

NAME (Lease prnery_MATLOWRNS > TITLE

Petroleum Engineer

-

5/12/2009

DATE

SIGNATORE __ Mw 5
/

{This space for State use only}

{5r2000) {See instructions on Reverse Side)



STATE OF UTA FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND,E

AN R ILJE P £ #f RN ML-47067
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS NA
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to G ate Can on
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. y
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
owwe [J  casweL OTHER Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APINUMBER:
Gasco Production Company 4301332685
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
8 Invemess Dr E, Ste 100 ., Englewood crare GO 50 80112 (303) 483-0044 Gate Canyon
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FooTAGES AT sURFacE: 1895' FSL & 2007' FWL county: Duchesne
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NESW 16  11S  15E STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[ NOTICE OF INTENT [ acioize [] oeeren [T] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit in Duplicate) ] autercasing [C] rracture TREAT [0 sioeTrRAck TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: ] casine rRepar [] wewconsTrRucTioN [[] vemporaRriLy ABANDON
[C] cHanGE To PREVIOUS PLANS [[] oreraTOR cHANGE [ rusinG Repar
CHANGE TUBING [] PLuc anD ABANDON [ ventorrLaAre
7 SUBSEQUEth IF\;:EPORT ] cHanGE weLL NAME [ ruesack [] water pisPosaL
(Submit Original Form Only)
bete of work cometet [ cHanGE weLL sTATUS [J PropucTION (START/IRESUME) [] warer stut-oFF
ate of work completion:
[[] coMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE /] orHer: Run Tubing
4/23/2009 [C] convertweL Tvre ] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, efc.
Gasco landed 344 joints of 2 3/8" 4.7# P-110 tubing with a 1.875" x-nipple on bottom @ 11,189' on 4/23/2009.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Mau’eﬂ‘ﬁ/ : mme Petroleum Engineer

5/12/2009

DATE

{This space for State use or‘/y)

RECEIVED
MAY 18 2009
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING

(6/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)



CONFIDENTIAL

STATE OF UTAH ‘ FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
o ; ML-47067
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N ALOTIEE ORTREERALE
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to 7'NLXIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

drilt horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

oLwelt [1  caswelL ] oTHER Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APINUMBER:
Gasco Production Company 4301332685
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
8 Inverness DrE, Ste 100 . Englewood srare OO 5 80112 (303) 483-0044 Wildcat
4. LOCATION OF WELL
rooTAGES AT surFace: 1895' FSL & 2007' FWL ‘ county: Duschene
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NESW - 16 11S  15E STATE:
, UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[] acwize ] oeeren [] REPERFORATE GURRENT FORMATION
m NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) 7] Atercasine [ eracture TrREAT [] siDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start [T] casiNneRrePaR [J wew consTrRucTION [[] TemporariLY ABANDON
[C] cHaneEe To PREVIOUS PLANS [ oreraToR cHaANGE [] tueinG RePaIR
[0 craneeTuBING [ Prueanp asanpon [] ventorrLaRE
[l suBseQUENT REPORT ] cHanee weLL name [] eueeack [ warerDisposaL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[/] cHance weLL sTATUS [[] PRODUCTION (START/IRESUME) [ water stut-oFF
Date of work completion:
[J comMmiNGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS || RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE [] orer:
[C] converTweLL TYPE [] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco Production Company would like to elect the status of this well to be changed to Wildcat. This well was drilled through the
Dakota Sandstone and is currently producing from the Mancos and Lower Mesaverde formations. There are two wells drilled
within one mile of this well and have been producing from the Mesaverde formation. Gasco intends to run a production log in
the near future to determine the percentage of gas producing from the Mancos intervals in order to determine the amount of
production we shall have a one year severance tax exemption on. Gasco will provide UDOGM with a copy of the production
log as soon as it has been received in our office.

Attached: Plat showing a one-mile radius around the bottom hole location of the Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15, a list of the
producing formations in the surrounding wells, a current wellbore schematic of the Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15.

COPY SENT TO OPERATOR
Pate: l lr v ZAC v m

‘ inhials:___ £ S

N pLease priry_Mattt Qwens— 7 e Petroleum Engineer
SIGNATU%%”L—_ . o 9? / o?L]' / JOOC[
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Producing Wells Within One Mile of Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15

[wen

Producing Formation

Gate Canyon State 41-20-11-15

Wasatch, Mesaverde

Gate Canyon State 31-21-11-15

Wasatch, Mesaverde
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2/9/2009
LEASE: ML-47067 WELL #: Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15

FIELD: Wildcat
LOCATION: 1895 FSL & 2007 FWL
COUNTY: Duchesne ST: Utah API: 43-013-32685
CONDUCTOR 1 1 GL:__6sir |
SIZE: 13 3/8" ! 1 KB: ~ 6847
WT/GRD: i \ SPUD DATE: 37172007 |
WT/GRD: I A 1 COMP DATE: “2/TI72009 |
CSA: 339
SX: sx 2% CaCl,
CIRC:
TOC: — Suf______ DATE FIRST PRODUCED 2/11/09
HOLE SIZE: VAV PRODUCTION METHOD —__ flow
—_— CHOKE SIZE 15064
SURFACE CASING Csg PRESSURE 3920
SIZE: 95/8" OIL (BBL) I
WT/GRD: T80 GAS (MCF) 3808
WT/GRD: 308 WATER (BBL) 585
CSA: 4,999 i
SX: 3230 sx Class G t =
SX class
CIRC:
TOC: Surf No TBG (2/9/09)
HOLE SIZE: o ;
PRODUCTION CASING
SIZE: 512"
WT/GRD: — P10
WT/GRD: — 238
CSA: — 16603
SX: 785 sx Class G
1770 sx 50/50 Poz G
CIRC: I S
TOC: Tnside Surf
HOLE SIZE: 7
Stinwdation
Stage 13: FR slick water/linear gel frac well
21712009 |W¥/43,000# 100 mesh sand, 130,400# = 11288-94 Stage 13 - Kenilworth
40/70 prime plus sand, 3,583 bbls == 11378-82 11436-38 Stage 13 - Kenilworth
FR slick water frac well w/4,0004# 100 ;
Stage 12: o 11502-05 11570-73 Stage 12 - Aberdeen
2/6/2009 |mesh sand, 163,000% 40/70 prime plus 11671-75 11735-38 Stage 12 = Spring Canyon
sand, 3,605 bbls FR slick water
Stage 11: _|PmP 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL acid. FR slick = 11900-08 Stage11- Panther
ﬂzg/eé /20'09 water frac well w/36,600#40/70 prime
plus, 1,293 bbls FR slick water
Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick water 12434-37 12506-09 Stage 10 - MN21
Stase 10: |frac well w/10,000% 100 mesh sand, 12549-52 12591-94 Stage 10 - MN21
f/s 12000 [#0.000# 40/70 white sand, 60,0004 40/70
prime plus sand, 3,008 bbls 12792-96 12825-29 Stage 9 - Mancos
q 12891-95 12976-80 Stage 9 - Mancos
FR slickwater frac well w/10,0004 100
Slaig/e5/92.009 mesh sand, 40,000¢ 40/70 white sand, 13054-58 13102-06 Stage 9 - Mancos
60,0004 40/70 prime plus, 3,041 bbls
Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick water 1327781 1335458 i i i
Stages: |frac well wl0,000# 100 mesh sand, s ety Ktoe 5 Mancds
/2000 |40.000% 40770 white sand, 60,0004 40/70 SRRp NS
prime plus sand, 3,640 bbls
Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick water]| 14092-56 TA252.56 Stiga - Maicos
frac well w/10,0004 100 mesh, 25,5004 ¥ £ R
Stage 7: o MG 14342-46 14365-69 Stage 7 - Mancos
2/4/2009 “;”70 W{:t; :‘;“5"; ;1’900# 40/70 prime 14433-37 14475-79 Stage 7 - Mancos
plus sand, 2, s
[Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick 3
Stage 6: . =F  14550-54 14601-05 Stage 6 - Mancos
1/25/2009 | Water/linear gel frac well w/81,000# PR =L 14743.47 1477175 Stage 6 - Mancos
6000 premium 40/70 sand, 5,320 bbls = 14822-26 14916-20 Stage 6 - Mancos
Stages: [PumP 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick
1/25/2009 | Water/linear gel frac well w/63,700% PRC L 1499599 15058-62 Stage 5 - Mancos
6000 premium 40/70 sand, 4,590 bbls = 15087-91 15157-61 Stage 5 - Mancos
S Hybrid frac well w/5,000# 100 mesh, == 15180-84 15238-42 15260-64 Stage 5 - Mancos
tage 4: g g W
11/15/2008 |65-000% 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,200 ™ NSund fill G 15.268" (2/8/2009)
bbis XL BHT gel @i’ 0K Magnum Aluminum BP @ 15,312" (1/22/2009)
; 10K Cast Iron FTFP @, 15,320" (1/20/2009)
Stage 3: :ISY '(’)gg#f’]a;/:“’fl\l/ 15,0007 10: “;ei:*g | Top of Fish @ 15.915' (19/2009)(Coil TBG BHA)
11/14/2008| "> ersaprop:sanc,.L. ool 15839-43 15869-73 Stage 4 - Dakota Silt
bbls 304 XL-BHT gel == 1591216 Stage 4 - Dakota Silt
Stage2: |ybrid frac well w/5,000% 100 mesh, 10K Magnum FTFP @ 15,950' (11/15/2008)
85,000# 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,648 4
10/30/2008 |°> prop saug; 4 =k 16112-22 Stage 3 - Dakota
bbls 30# XL-BHT gel 10K Magnium FIFP G 16.148" (11/14/2008)
& == 16224-34 Stage 2 - Dakota
Stage 1: g‘gggg;’;‘;:f{'/:’/ 5,000 10(; “;e;l;*s 10K Magniim FTFP @ 16,256 (10/30/2008)
10/29/2008| "% rsa prop sand, 1, 16446-54 Stage 1 - Morrison
bbls 30# XL-BHT gel 16486-90 Stage 1 - Morrison
Prepared/Revised by: Date Reviewed by: | Date rille ugs wi Col
MRO 2/11/2009|
MD 16,610 PBTD @ 15,268' (2/8/2009)
TD 16,485




DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
Wildcat Well Determination
STATEMENT OF BASIS

Applicant: Gasco Production Company

Location: NESW Sec. 16 T11S, R15E, Duchesne County, Utah

WELL NAME: Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15 APl #: 43-013-32685
FINDINGS

1.

2.

3.

The subject well was spud on March 23, 2008. Total depth was reached on June
14, 2008 and the well was completed on February 11, 2009.

This well is currently producing from the Mesaverde and Mancos formations from a
depth of 11288’ to 15264’.

This well is < 1 mile from known production out of the Wasatch and Mesaverde
formations and > 1 mile from known production out of the Mancos formation (See
Attachment A).

No information has been submitted that shows the amount of production coming
from the Mancos formation.

CONCLUSIONS

Based on the findings above the Division has determined the Uteland State 34-2-
10-18 well is producing in an unknown area for the Mancos formation. Therefore,
the Division finds this well qualifies for the severance tax exemption under Section
59-5-102(2)(d) for wildcat wells for production from the Mancos formation only. A
determination of percentage of production attributable to the Mancos formation can
not be made with the information submitted. Any production from the Wasatch -
Mesa Verde formations would not qualify for severance tax exemption as they are
well known for production in the 1 mile area of review. This determination was made
in accordance with Oil and Gas General Conservation Rule R649-3-35.

Reviewer(s): Dustin K. Doucet (\)Lé,\ Date: _November 19, 2009



ATTACHMENT A

1 Mile Area of Review

AP| JWELL_NAME [Well Status [QTR_ [Sect [Town [Range JCum Oil [Cum Gas [Field Type [Dx from Well(ft) [Rotary Spud [Date TD Reached [Date first Produced [Producing Formation
4301333858 |GATE CYN ST 12-21-11-15 APD ISWNW 21 110S 150E |0 0 D 3923 S e | 3 e - B
4301332685 GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 DRL NESW 16 1108 150E 0 111 E 0 R °Y | 774 / ‘,‘jS F i Iﬁ«‘ T il AVIsEY - 717 JeC I
4301332618 |GATE CYN ST 12-21-11-15 LA ISWNW 21 1110S 150E 10 0 D 3923 - i * e
4301332475 |GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 PGW _ NENE 20 |110S 150E 1425 65326 D 3629 5-d-0G EEEY Y [ wsmvo
4301332391 |GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 SGW NWNE ({21 11108 150E 862 277521 D 2938 e Dl = DD ) Lo py MV eD
' ( BLeit HWK)
S T
) elg
Qs




API Well No: 43013326850000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
ML-47067

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
GATE CANYON

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43013326850000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112

PHONE NUMBER:
303 483-0044 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
GATE CANYON

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:

1895 FSL 2007 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 16 Township: 11.0S Range: 15.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
DUCHESNE

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING
!/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [} cHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [] cHANGE TuBING
10/12/2010
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS
[] SUBSEQUENT REPORT [ peepen [J FRACTURE TREAT
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE
D DRILLING REPORT D WATER SHUTOFF D SI TA STATUS EXTENSION
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER

CASING REPAIR

CHANGE WELL NAME

CONVERT WELL TYPE

NEW CONSTRUCTION

PLUG BACK

RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

TEMPORARY ABANDON

s oooononod

WATER DISPOSAL

|

APD EXTENSION

OTHER: l—

Gasco would like to dispose of water at RN Industries state approved
commercial disposal facility located in Sections 4 and 9 Township 2 south
Range 2 west in Bluebell UT. This facility would be used in addition to the

this well.

Date:

By: \

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Approved by the
Utah Division of

currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose of water from 0il, Gas and Mining

October 06, 2010
Yook Y |

NN

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)
Roger Knight

PHONE NUMBER
303 996-1803

TITLE
EHS Supervisor

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
10/5/2010

RECEIVED October 05, 2010




API Well No: 43013326850000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
ML-47067

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
GATE CANYON

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43013326850000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
GATE CANYON

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:

1895 FSL 2007 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 16 Township: 11.0S Range: 15.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
DUCHESNE

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
!/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [} cHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [] cHANGE TuBING [} cHANGE WELL NAME
1/7/2011
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
[] SUBSEQUENT REPORT [ peepen [J FRACTURE TREAT [] NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE !/ WATER DISPOSAL
[] DRILLING REPORT [0 waTER sHuTOFF [0 s1TA sTATUS EXTENSION [0 app ExTENsION
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER:

state approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 30, 2 south

to the currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose of
water from this well.

Range 4 west in North Blue Bench UT. This facility would be used in addition

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Gasco would like to dispose of water at Integrated Water management, LLC

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

Date:__ 12/30/2010

By: L.

)

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Roger Knight 303 996-1803 EHS Supervisor
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 12/29/2010

RECEIVED December 29, 2010




Sundry Number: 19598 APl Wl | Number: 43013326850000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-47067 :
. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS e OTTEEO
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current -
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
DRILL form for such proposals. GATE CANYON
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43013326850000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext GATE CANYON
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1895 FSL 2007 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 16 Township: 11.0S Range: 15.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
V’ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING D CHANGE WELL NAME
D CHANGE WELL STATUS !/ COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
[ sueseQUENT REPORT (] peepen ¥’ FRACTURE TREAT [] NEw consTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE ( RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: !/ REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
[] DRILLING REPORT [] wATER SHUTOFF [] sITa STATUS EXTENSION [] app ExTENSION
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Gasco intends to fracture stimulate all remaining productive intervals in the
Mesaverde and Wasatch formations with approximately 8 stages. Each stage
will utilize roughly 55,000 #'s of white sand and 1,350 bbls of water. This well Approved by the

is currently producing from the Mancos and Mesaverde formations. Gasco Utah Division of
intends to commingle production from the Mancos, Mesaverde and Wasatch ~ Oil, Gas and Mining
formations. Gasco is the leasehold owner of all contiguous leases to this - 12/06/2 1\1
location. Gasco does not feel that allocation is necessary, but if required willate: { \\. ] rQ \ .
be done by individual interval hydrocarbon pore volume calculations. A ﬂ )g/k (L L/_J,u,-j
subsequent report outlining the work done will be submitted shortly after tHy: i

work is completed.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 10/19/2011

RECEIVED Cct. 19, 2011




Sundry Nunber: 22065 APl Well Nunber: 43013326850000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

ML-47067

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
GATE CANYON

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43013326850000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112

PHONE NUMBER:
303 483-0044 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
GATE CANYON

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
1895 FSL 2007 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 16 Township: 11.0S Range: 15.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
DUCHESNE

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING
D NOTICE OF INTENT I chancE To PREVIOUS PLANS O chance TusinG
Approximate date work will start:
l:‘ CHANGE WELL STATUS J COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS
v‘( SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: l:‘ DEEPEN 'U‘( FRACTURE TREAT
l:‘ OPERATOR CHANGE l:‘ PLUG AND ABANDON
1 spub rerorT [ propucTion START OR RESUME L recLamaTiON OF WELL SITE
Date of Spud:
v‘( REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
l:‘ TUBING REPAIR l:‘ VENT OR FLARE

l:‘ DRILLING REPORT

Report Date: l:‘ SI TA STATUS EXTENSION

l:‘ OTHER

l:‘ WATER SHUTOFF

l:‘ WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION

|:| CASING REPAIR

D CHANGE WELL NAME

(]
(]
O
v
(]

D WATER DISPOSAL

CONVERT WELL TYPE

NEW CONSTRUCTION

PLUG BACK

RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

TEMPORARY ABANDON

|:| APD EXTENSION

OTHER: I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco has completed fracture treating the remaining productive
intervals in the Mesaverde and Wasatch formations. The volumes of
sand and water used to pump each stage can be found on the attached
wellbore schematic under stage 14 through stage 20. Plugs have been
drilled and tubing was landed at 8,828 in preparation for a production
log. This well is currently producing out of the Mancos, Mesaverde and
Wasatch formations.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY

January 12, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)
Jessica Berg

PHONE NUMBER
303 996-1805

TITLE
Production Tech

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
1/11/2012

RECEI VED: Jan.

11, 2012




Sundry Nunber :

22065 AP

Vel |

Nunber :

43013326850000

As of 12/30/2011
LEASE: ML-47067 WELL #: Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15
FIELD: Wildcat
LOCATION: 1895’ FSL & 2007 FWL
COUNTY: Duchesne ST: Utah API: 43-013-32685
CONDUCTOR T T GL: 6817
SIZE: i | B:_ 6842°
WT/GRD: | ] SPUD DATE: __ 5/1/2007
WT/GRD: T n COMP DATE: ~ 271172009
coA: i |
CIRC: : E E
TOC: i 1 DATE FIRST PRODUCED 2/11/09
HOLE SIZE ! ] PRODUCTION METHOD flow
! ! CHOKE SIZE 15764
SURFACE CASING | 1 Csg PRESSURE 3921
SIZE: 95/8" i 1 OIL (BBL) 0
WT/GRD: L-80 i 1 GAS (MCF) 3808
WT/GRD: 40% | 1 WATER (BBL) 585
CSA: 999 L 1]
SX: 3230 sx Class G
510 sx class G Note: Possible remaining Wasatch to examine/test before
CIRC: Y well abandonment. (1/11/2012)
TOC: Surf
HOLE SIZE 12 174"
PRODUCTION CASING
SIZE: 51 ; g - "
WT/GRD 5 Land tubing @ 8828 with 271 jts 2 3/8" EUE]
WT/GRD! 237 8rnd 4.7# P-.110 tubing + 2 3/8 x 1.875 x-
CSA: 16,603 nipple (12/30/2011)
SX: 785 sx Class G
1770 sx 50/50 Poz G
CIRC: Y
TOC: Inside Surf
HOLE SIZE 78
Stimulation
FR slick water frac well w/ 1564# 100 EOT@
Stage 20: 1|mesh sand, 59,377 40770 white sand, bl o Stage 20 - Upper Mesaverde
1204 bbls 2% FR slick water. —l-  8993-96
FR slick water frac well w/ 1244# 100
Stage 19 1|mesh sand, 62.016# 40770 white sand, oo oTiTs seeeTlo Stage 19 - Lower Mesaverde
1295 bbls FR slick water. —l-  9723-26
stage 18: R slick water frac well w/ 1404# 100 m- g;g;g g;gggé Stage 18 - Lower Mesaverde
i 2611 |mesh sand, 74,879# 40/70 white sand, B oe3.39 935761
1503 bbls 2% FR slick water. 1=  0884-87
FR slick water frac well w/ 1344# 100
Stage 17 | mesh sand, 68,009 40770 white sand, L e et Stage 17 - Lower Mesaverde
1423 bbls 2% FR slick water. —1-  10061-63 10077-79
51‘;/91%/12%11 FR slick water frac well w/ 18224 100 i }gg‘l‘ggg }ggggggo Stage 16 - Lower Mesaverde
mesh sand, 83,470# 40/70 white sand, - 1034044 10358.60
1625 bbls 2% FR CIO2 slick water. 10374-78 10400-04
== 10422-26
FR slick water frac well w/ 1147# 100
Stage 12 1|mesh sand, 53,111¢ 40770 white sand, T o7e0-bt 1086466 Stage 15 - Desert/Grassy
1023 bbls 2% FR CIO2 slick water. =l 10934-36
FR slick water frac well w/ 600# 100 mesh .
S ot [sand. 48075 40/70 white sand, 1349 bbls oo e Stage 14 - Sunnyside
FR slick water (CIO2 water). = 11137-41
Stage 13: FR slick water/linear gel frac well
20712009 w/_43.000# 100 mesh sand, 180,400# 40/70 _l- 11083.94 Stage 13 - Kenilworth
prime plus sand, 3,583 bbls =i=  11378-82 11436-38
FR slick water frac well w/4,000# 100 1
Stage 2. |mesh sand, 163,000 40/70 prime plus o [a0efs e Stage 12 - Aberdeen
sand, 3,605 bbls FR slick water
Stage 11: |PUMP 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL acid. FR slick ==  11900-08 Stage 11 - Panther
3000 | water frac well wi36,600#40/70 prime
plus, 1,293 bbls FR slick water
Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick water |- 12434-37 12506-09 Stage 10 - MN21
Stage 10: frac well w/10,000# 100 mesh sand, mi=  12549-52 12591-94
/2009 40,000 40/70 white sand, 60,0004 40/70
prime plus sand, 3,008 bbls 12792-96 12825-29 Stage 9 - Mancos
Stage 9: FR slickwater frac well w/10,000# 100 i gggigg g%ggg
o 00 | mesh sand, 40,0004 40/70 white sand, m : 3
60,0004 40/70 prime plus, 3,041 bbls
Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick water |- 13777-81 13354-58 Stage 8 - Mancos
Stage 8: frac well w/10,000# 100 mesh sand, ; ; ggggg ggg;é}(
/5009 | 40,000 40/70 white sand, 60,0004 40/70
prime plus sand, 3,640 bbls
Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick water
Stage 7. |frac well w/10,000¢ 100 mesh, 25,500% ok Taoor e Stage 7 - Mancos
3/4/2'009 40/70 white sand, 37,500# 40/70 prime _l=  14433-37 14475-79
plus sand, 2,595 bbls
Stages: | /UmP 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick =l-  14550-54 14601-05 Stage 6 - Mancos
1/25/2009 |Water/linear gel frac well w/81,000# PR D= 14743-47 1477175
6000 premium 40/70 sand, 5,320 bbls 1= 14822-26 14916-20
Stages: | FUmP 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick 14995-99 15058-62 Stage 5 - Mancos
1/25/2009 |Water/linear gel frac well w/68,700# PRC _ 15087.91 15157-61
6000 premium 40/70 sand, 4,590 bbls l, == 15180-84 15238-42 15260-64
Stage 4: Hybrid frac well w/5,000# 100 mesh, ’—\1D0u}2ngailalllfgnngfsce?gTSuZ%13(? 15,264
11/915/2-008 65,000# 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,200 bbls L Sand fill b
XL BHT gel [$4—10K Magnum Aluminum BP @ 15,312 (1/22/2009)
Stage3: _[Fybrd fracwell wis,000¢ 100 mesh Top o Fih © 1515, (1912009 Coll T8 BHA)
11/14/2008] 7>:000# 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,549 bbls «f=1= 15839-43 15860-73 Stage 4 - Dakota Silt
30# XL-BHT gel Q == 15912-16
. Hybrid frac well w/5,000# 100 mesh, .
Stage 2: |5 000# 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,648 bbls 110K Magnum FTFP @ 15,950 (11/15/2008)
10/30/2008 == 16112-22 Stage 3 - Dakota
30# XL-BHT gel 10K Magn@m FTFP @ 16,148" (11/14/2008)
Stage 1: Hybrid frac well w/5,000# 100 mesh, BN 1&22’\3";;:} FTEP @ 16,256' (f&%%izzobgakma
10/29/2008 | 70+000% 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,518 bbls _l 1644654 Stage 1 - Morrison
30# XL-BHT gel =)= 16486-90
By Date
KTM 1112012
MD 16,610 PBTD @ 15263" with 470 jts tubing (12/29/2011)
TD 16,485

RECEI VED: Jan.

11, 2012



Sundry Nunber: 22624 APl Well Nunber: 43013326850000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

ML-47067

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
GATE CANYON

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43013326850000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112

PHONE NUMBER:
303 483-0044 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
GATE CANYON

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
1895 FSL 2007 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 16 Township: 11.0S Range: 15.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
DUCHESNE

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING
D NOTICE OF INTENT I chancE To PREVIOUS PLANS O chance TusinG
Approximate date work will start:
l:‘ CHANGE WELL STATUS J COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS
v‘( SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: l:‘ DEEPEN 'U‘( FRACTURE TREAT
l:‘ OPERATOR CHANGE l:‘ PLUG AND ABANDON
1 spub rerorT [ propucTion START OR RESUME L recLamaTiON OF WELL SITE
Date of Spud:
v‘( REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
l:‘ TUBING REPAIR l:‘ VENT OR FLARE

l:‘ DRILLING REPORT

Report Date: l:‘ SI TA STATUS EXTENSION

l:‘ OTHER

l:‘ WATER SHUTOFF

l:‘ WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION

|:| CASING REPAIR

D CHANGE WELL NAME

(]
(]
O
/ RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O

D WATER DISPOSAL

CONVERT WELL TYPE
NEW CONSTRUCTION
PLUG BACK

TEMPORARY ABANDON

|:| APD EXTENSION

OTHER: I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco has completed fracture treating the remaining productive
intervals in the Mesaverde formation. The volumes of sand and water
used to pump each stage can be found on the attached wellbore

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

schematic under stage 14 through stage 20. Plugs have been drilled and FOR RECORD ONLY

tubing was landed at 8,828' in preperation for a production log. This
well is currently producing out of the Mancos and Measaverde
formations.

February 01, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)
Jessica Berg

PHONE NUMBER
303 996-1805

TITLE
Production Tech

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
1/31/2012

RECEI VED: Jan.

31, 2012




Sundry Nunber :

22624 AP

Vel |

Nunber :

43013326850000

As of 12/30/2011
LEASE: ML-47067 WELL #: Gate Canyon State 23-16-11-15
FIELD: Wildcat
LOCATION: 1895’ FSL & 2007 FWL
COUNTY: Duchesne ST: Utah API: 43-013-32685
CONDUCTOR T T GL: 6817
SIZE: i | B:_ 6842°
WT/GRD: | ] SPUD DATE: __ 5/1/2007
WT/GRD: T n COMP DATE: ~ 271172009
coA: i |
CIRC: : E E
TOC: i 1 DATE FIRST PRODUCED 2/11/09
HOLE SIZE ! ] PRODUCTION METHOD flow
! ! CHOKE SIZE 15764
SURFACE CASING | 1 Csg PRESSURE 3921
SIZE: 95/8" i 1 OIL (BBL) 0
WT/GRD: L-80 i 1 GAS (MCF) 3808
WT/GRD: 40% | 1 WATER (BBL) 585
CSA: 999 L 1]
SX: 3230 sx Class G
510 sx class G Note: Possible remaining Wasatch to examine/test before
CIRC: Y well abandonment. (1/11/2012)
TOC: Surf
HOLE SIZE 12 174"
PRODUCTION CASING
SIZE: 51 ; g - "
WT/GRD 5 Land tubing @ 8828 with 271 jts 2 3/8" EUE]
WT/GRD! 237 8rnd 4.7# P-.110 tubing + 2 3/8 x 1.875 x-
CSA: 16,603 nipple (12/30/2011)
SX: 785 sx Class G
1770 sx 50/50 Poz G
CIRC: Y
TOC: Inside Surf
HOLE SIZE 78
Stimulation
FR slick water frac well w/ 1564# 100 EOT@
Stage 20: 1|mesh sand, 59,377 40770 white sand, bl o Stage 20 - Upper Mesaverde
1204 bbls 2% FR slick water. —l-  8993-96
FR slick water frac well w/ 1244# 100
Stage 19 1|mesh sand, 62.016# 40770 white sand, oo oTiTs seeeTlo Stage 19 - Lower Mesaverde
1295 bbls FR slick water. —l-  9723-26
stage 18: R slick water frac well w/ 1404# 100 m- g;g;g g;gggé Stage 18 - Lower Mesaverde
i 2611 |mesh sand, 74,879# 40/70 white sand, B oe3.39 935761
1503 bbls 2% FR slick water. 1=  0884-87
FR slick water frac well w/ 1344# 100
Stage 17 | mesh sand, 68,009 40770 white sand, L e et Stage 17 - Lower Mesaverde
1423 bbls 2% FR slick water. —1-  10061-63 10077-79
51‘;/91%/12%11 FR slick water frac well w/ 18224 100 i }gg‘l‘ggg }ggggggo Stage 16 - Lower Mesaverde
mesh sand, 83,470# 40/70 white sand, - 1034044 10358.60
1625 bbls 2% FR CIO2 slick water. 10374-78 10400-04
== 10422-26
FR slick water frac well w/ 1147# 100
Stage 12 1|mesh sand, 53,111¢ 40770 white sand, T o7e0-bt 1086466 Stage 15 - Desert/Grassy
1023 bbls 2% FR CIO2 slick water. =l 10934-36
FR slick water frac well w/ 600# 100 mesh .
S ot [sand. 48075 40/70 white sand, 1349 bbls oo e Stage 14 - Sunnyside
FR slick water (CIO2 water). = 11137-41
Stage 13: FR slick water/linear gel frac well
20712009 w/_43.000# 100 mesh sand, 180,400# 40/70 _l- 11083.94 Stage 13 - Kenilworth
prime plus sand, 3,583 bbls =i=  11378-82 11436-38
FR slick water frac well w/4,000# 100 1
Stage 2. |mesh sand, 163,000 40/70 prime plus o [a0efs e Stage 12 - Aberdeen
sand, 3,605 bbls FR slick water
Stage 11: |PUMP 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL acid. FR slick ==  11900-08 Stage 11 - Panther
3000 | water frac well wi36,600#40/70 prime
plus, 1,293 bbls FR slick water
Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick water |- 12434-37 12506-09 Stage 10 - MN21
Stage 10: frac well w/10,000# 100 mesh sand, mi=  12549-52 12591-94
/2009 40,000 40/70 white sand, 60,0004 40/70
prime plus sand, 3,008 bbls 12792-96 12825-29 Stage 9 - Mancos
Stage 9: FR slickwater frac well w/10,000# 100 i gggigg g%ggg
o 00 | mesh sand, 40,0004 40/70 white sand, m : 3
60,0004 40/70 prime plus, 3,041 bbls
Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick water |- 13777-81 13354-58 Stage 8 - Mancos
Stage 8: frac well w/10,000# 100 mesh sand, ; ; ggggg ggg;é}(
/5009 | 40,000 40/70 white sand, 60,0004 40/70
prime plus sand, 3,640 bbls
Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick water
Stage 7. |frac well w/10,000¢ 100 mesh, 25,500% ok Taoor e Stage 7 - Mancos
3/4/2'009 40/70 white sand, 37,500# 40/70 prime _l=  14433-37 14475-79
plus sand, 2,595 bbls
Stages: | /UmP 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick =l-  14550-54 14601-05 Stage 6 - Mancos
1/25/2009 |Water/linear gel frac well w/81,000# PR D= 14743-47 1477175
6000 premium 40/70 sand, 5,320 bbls 1= 14822-26 14916-20
Stages: | FUmP 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slick 14995-99 15058-62 Stage 5 - Mancos
1/25/2009 |Water/linear gel frac well w/68,700# PRC _ 15087.91 15157-61
6000 premium 40/70 sand, 4,590 bbls l, == 15180-84 15238-42 15260-64
Stage 4: Hybrid frac well w/5,000# 100 mesh, ’—\1D0u}2ngailalllfgnngfsce?gTSuZ%13(? 15,264
11/915/2-008 65,000# 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,200 bbls L Sand fill b
XL BHT gel [$4—10K Magnum Aluminum BP @ 15,312 (1/22/2009)
Stage3: _[Fybrd fracwell wis,000¢ 100 mesh Top o Fih © 1515, (1912009 Coll T8 BHA)
11/14/2008] 7>:000# 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,549 bbls «f=1= 15839-43 15860-73 Stage 4 - Dakota Silt
30# XL-BHT gel Q == 15912-16
. Hybrid frac well w/5,000# 100 mesh, .
Stage 2: |5 000# 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,648 bbls 110K Magnum FTFP @ 15,950 (11/15/2008)
10/30/2008 == 16112-22 Stage 3 - Dakota
30# XL-BHT gel 10K Magn@m FTFP @ 16,148" (11/14/2008)
Stage 1: Hybrid frac well w/5,000# 100 mesh, BN 1&22’\3";;:} FTEP @ 16,256' (f&%%izzobgakma
10/29/2008 | 70+000% 18/40 Versa prop sand, 1,518 bbls _l 1644654 Stage 1 - Morrison
30# XL-BHT gel =)= 16486-90
By Date
KTM 1112012
MD 16,610 PBTD @ 15263" with 470 jts tubing (12/29/2011)
TD 16,485

RECEI VED: Jan.

31, 2012



Division of Qil, Gas and Mining

Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 4/16/2015

FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERATOR:

Gasco Prodcution Company N2575 Badlands Production Company N4265

7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500 7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500

Denver, CO 80237 Denver, CO 80237

303-996-1805 303-996-1805

CA Number(s): Unit(s):Gate Canyon, Wilkin Ridge Deep, RBU-EOR-GRRV
WELL INFORMATION:

Well Name Sec [TWN [RNG [API Entity Mineral |Surface |[Type Status
See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION:

1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2015
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2015
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 1454161-0143

REVIEW:

1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 6/2/2015
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: N/A

3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/3/2015

4. OPS/SI/TA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 1/20/2016

5. UICS on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: N/A

6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: None

7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): N/A
NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:

1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: SUR0027842

2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A

3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): SUR0027845

DATA ENTRY:

1. Well(s) update in the OGIS on:

2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on:

3. Unit(s) operator number update in OGIS on:

4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on:

5. State/Fee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on:
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on:

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:

SUR0035619 -FCB

1/22/2016
1/22/2016
1/22/2016
N/A
1/22/2016
N/A

1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 1/22/2016

COMMENTS:

1/22/2016



From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

Well Name Section |TWN |RNG |API Number |Entity |Mineral |Surface |Type |Status
FEDERAL 23-18G-9-19 18 090S | 190E 4304752496 Federal Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 14-17G-9-19 17 090S |190E |4304752522 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 13-18G-9-19 18 090S |190E 4304752538 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 23-29G-9-19 29 090S |190E |4304752544 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 24-20G-9-19 20 090S |190E 4304752545 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 31-21G-9-19 21 090S |190E 4304752546 Federal |Federal OW |APD
Federal 323-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753026 Federal Federal GW |APD
Federal 421-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753027 Federal |Federal | GW |APD
Federal 322-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753029 Federal |Federal GW |APD
Federal 431-29-9-19 29 090S |190E [4304753030 | Federal |Federal GW |APD
Federal 432-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753031 | Federal Federal GW |APD
Federal 414-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753070 Federal |Federal GW |APD
FEDERAL 412-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753073 Federal |Federal GW |APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753076 Federal |Federal | GW |APD
federal 321-29-9-19 29 090S |190E|4304753078 Federal |Federal (GW |APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S | 190E 4304753079 Federal |Federal GW |APD
FEDERAL 321-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753080 Federal |Federal GW |APD
Federal 212-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753133 Federal |Federal GW |APD
State 321-32-9-19 32 090S |190E |4304754479 State State |GW_|APD
State 423-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754480 State State |GW |APD
State 421-32-9-19 32 090S |190E |4304754481 State State |GW_|APD
State 413-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754482 State State |GW |APD
State 323-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754483 State State |GW |APD
State 431-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754529 State State |GW |APD
Desert Spring State 224-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304754541 State State |GW |APD
Desert Spring State 243-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304754542 State State |GW |APD
Desert Spring State 241-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304754543 State State |GW APD
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304753012 |19650 Federal |Federal | GW |DRL
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 100S |170E 4301333098 (15941 |Federal |Federal (GW |OPS
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 090S |190E 4304736915 {16556 |Fee Fee GW _|OPS
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S |180E 4304738573 17201 |Federal Federal |(GW |OPS
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304739777 |18344 |[Federal Federal GW |OPS
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S |190E 4304739800 [17202 |Federal Federal GW |OPS
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 110S |150E 4301332391 13787 |State State |GW [P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 100S |170E 4301332447 114033 |State State |GW_|P
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 110S |150E 4301332475 |14417 State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 100S |170E 4301332560 [14726 |Federal |Federal | GW |P
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 110S |160E 4301332611 14439 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332619 15649 |State State |GW [P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 124-11-17 4 110S |170E|4301332674 |15537 |Federal |Federal GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 100S |170E|4301332676 |15242 |State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 100S |170E 4301332679 14033 |[Federal |Federal  GW |P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 16 110S |150E 4301332685 [16082 State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 100S |170E 4301332730 |15243 |State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 100S |170E 4301332773 |15370 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 8 110S [170E 4301332778 14802 Federal |Federal | GW [P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 1110S |160E 4301332888 15098 |State State |GW P
|WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 100S [170E|4301333081 |15714 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 100S |170E 4301333087 ;15807 [Federal |Federal \GW |P
|WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 110S [170E|4301333099 ;15920 Federal |[Federal GW [P
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 110S |140E 4301333437 |16919 Federal |Federal | GW |P
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 i 24 110S !140E 4301333443 /16367 Federal [Federal GW |P
SQUAW CROSSING U 5 2 100S |180E 4304730129 16266 |State State |OW [P
RBU 5-11D 11 100S |180E 4304730409 9005 |Federal Federal OW P |
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 090S | 180E 4304730624 (9030 |Federal |Federal |OW |P




From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU 6-2D 2 100S [180E 4304731190 |7075 |State |State |OW |P
NGC 33-18J 18 090S |190E 4304731200 |6155 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
RBU 13-2D 2 100S |180E 4304731280 |16267 |State  |State |OW |P
RBU 16-3D 3 100S |180E 4304731352 |16268 [Federal |Federal OW |P
RBU 10-11D 11 100S |180E 4304731357 |7053 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
RBU 8-10D 10 100S |180E 4304731364 (4955 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
RBU 15-3D 3 100S |180E 4304731539 |9965 |Federal |Federal OW |P
RBU 12-12D 12 100S [180E 4304731651 |10688 |Federal |Federal OW |P
RBU 2-10D 10 100S |180E[4304731801 {10784 |Federal |Federal | OW |P
RBU 3-15D 15 100S |180E [4304733600 |13213 [Federal |Federal  OW |P
RBU 3-12D 12 100S |180E [4304733739 |14492 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
STATE 7-36A 36 090S |180E|4304733741 14244 State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 34-29 29 090S |190E|4304733750 |13174 Federal Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 100S |180E 4304733983 |13182 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 090S |[190E|4304734111 113441 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 24-20-9-19 20 090S |190E 4304734168 |14150 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FED 44-20-9-19 20 090S | 190E 4304734169 |14140 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S |190E 4304734199 |13601 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304734201 |13641 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 42-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304734202 |13455 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 100S |170E [4304734286 |13492 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
STATE 4-32B 32 090S |190E[4304734314 |14440 State  |State |GW |P
FED 14-18-2 #1 18 100S | 180E 4304734539 13491 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 100S |170E |4304734551 |13726 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 090S |190E 4304734607 113640 Federal |Federal |GW [P
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S |190E 14304734608 [14151 Federal |Federal (GW |P
FED 22-30-10-18 30 100S |180E 4304734924 [14280 [Federal |Federal (GW |P
FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304735343 14202 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 11-22-9-19 22 090S |190E|4304735404 [14203 Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 42-21-9-19 21 090S |190E[4304735405 {14928 |Federal |Federal GW |P
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 090S |190E[4304735588 |14418 |State | Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S |190E 4304735606 |14441 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 090S |190E|4304735614 |14442 Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 090S |190E (4304735623 114640 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304735624 14419 |Federal |Federal [GW |P
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 090S |190E|4304735732 14496 |Fee Fee |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 090S |190E|4304735733 14519 |Fee Fee |GW |P
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 100S |180E 4304735808 |15592 |[Federal Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 100S |190E 4304735844 14356 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304735845 |14639 |State  |State |GW |P
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 090S |190E|4304735995 |14871 State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S |190E 4304736093 |14976 |Federal |Federal |(GW |P
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S |190E[4304736094 [16120 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304736095 |14872 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 090S |180E 4304736113 |15096 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304736219 |14738 |State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304736220 (14763 State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304736233 |14764 State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304736241 |14992 [State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S |180E (4304736242 |14716 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 090S |190E|4304736271 15884 Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304736336 |15086 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304736368 |15605 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304736442 |15715 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304736600 14977 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304736719 |15186 Federal Federal | GW |P




From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company

Effective Date: 4/16/2015

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 125 090S |180E 4304736727 !15475 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304736739 |15476 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304736740 |15213 |Federal |Federal [GW |P
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S |190E|4304736771 |15355 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 090S | 180E 4304736772 |15338 [Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 30 090S ' 190E (4304736817 15212 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 090S |190F 4304736913 |15187 |Fee Fee |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 090S |190E 4304736916 (17012 |Fee Fee |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304737115 |15011 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 090S |190E (4304737116 |16163 Federal |Federal (GW |P
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 090S 190F 4304737117 |16275 |Federal [Federal |GW [P
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180F 4304737132 |15087 |State  |State |GW [P
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S |180F 4304737338 15365 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304737611 [16311 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S |190F 4304737612 16051 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304737613 (16052 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S (190E 4304737621 |16253 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S |190F [4304737622 |16264 Federal Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304737630 |16557 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S |180F 4304737631 15961 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S |180F 4304737646 16023 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S '180F |4304737647 16121 |Federal [Federal GW |P
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S |180E 4304737676 16254 State  |State |GW P
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 100S |180F 4304737677 |15806 |State  |State |GW |P
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S |180E 4304738028 |16868 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S | 190F |4304738336 (16467 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 090S |190F [4304738337 16119 |[Federal |Federal GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S |180E 4304738351 |16884 |Federal [Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304738352 |16349 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S |180F 4304738353 16210 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S | 190F |4304738407 16236 |Federal |Federal GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 090S |180F 4304738465 16558 |[Federal |Federal GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304738469 |16449 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S |190E |4304738575 |16312 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S | 190F |4304738673 115832 |Fee Fee |GW [P
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 11 100S |180E 4304738896 16792 Federal |Federal GW P
STATE 21-32B 32 090S |190E 4304739170 |16309 |State  |State |GW |P
STATE 22-32A 32 090S '190E 4304739171 /16308 [State  |State |GW |P
STATE 21-32A 32 090S '190F [4304739172 [16310 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S |190F [4304739717 |17054 Federal |[Federal |GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304739729 |17241 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304739730 (17266 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 1 100S |180E |4304739773 (17013 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S |190E 4304740233 |17014 |[Federal Federal |GW [P
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S |190E 14304751280 |18211 |Federal |Federal | OW |P
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304751281 |18210 |[Federal |Federal | OW |P
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190 4304752870 {19647 |[Federal |Federal GW |P
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S |190F 4304752872 |19648 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19 ] 30 090S |190E 4304753011 |19649 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S |180F (4304753324 [19783 |State  |State |GW |P
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S |180F 4304753325 |19783 |State  |State |GW |P
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S |180F |4304753326 19747 |State  |State |GW |P
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304753327 |19747 |State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S |180F 4304753328 '19783 [State  |State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S '170E[4301332677 |15144 |State  |State |GW S
RBU 4-11D 11 100S |180E 14304730718 |16269 |Federal |Federal (OW [S




From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU 2-11D 11 100S |180E |4304730826 116270 |[Federal |Federal OW |S
RBU 6-11D 11 100S |180E 4304731192 16271 |Federal |Federal OW |S
STATE 2-32B 32 090S |190E 4304732221 |11371 State  |State |GW_|S
STATE 9-36A 36 090S |180E |4304732225 |11364 |State  |State |GW |S
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S |190E 4304733581 |13249 |Federal |Federal |GW |S
STATE 13-36A 36 090S |180E|4304733598 17838 |State  |State |GW |S
FEDERAL 16-26A - 26 090S |180E 4304733601 |12928 |Federal 'Federal | GW |S
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S |190E 4304733653 13077 |[Federal Federal (GW |S
RBU 1-10D 10 100S |180E|4304734312 [16265 |[Federal |Federal OW 'S
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S |190E 4304739776 (17149 Federal |Federal GW |S




STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU-76482

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

®. IFINDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WEL
Y owwew [J

GAS WELL OTHER

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

Desert Spring Fed 21-1-10-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:

9. API NUMBER:

Gasco Production Company 4304737631
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10, FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDGAT-
7979 E. Tufts Ave. crry Denver s1are CO 580237 (303) 483-0044 Uteland Butte
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FooTAGES AT sURFAce: 0633 FNL 1512 FWL county: Uintah

QTR/AQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 1 108 18E S STATE: y

TAH
. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION _ TYPE OF ACTION
[ aciize [J oeeren [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

2] nNoTiCE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) [ Arercasing

Approximate date work will start [[] casingrepar

4/16/2015

[] crance TueinG

[] suBseQUENTREPORT  |[T] cHaNce weLL NAME

(Submit Originat Form Only)

Date of work completion:

[C] converT weLL Type

[ cHance To PREVIOUS PLANS

[] cHance weLL sTaTUS
[C] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS

[[] eracture TrReAT

[C] ~ewconsTRucTION

[/] oPeraTOR CHaNGE

[ Puucanp ABanDON

[ ruseack

[] ProDUCTION (STARTRESUME)

[J RecLAMATION OF WELL SITE

[C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

[[] sibETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
[J TeEmPORARILY ABANDON
] rtueinc Repair

[J venrorFLare

[ warter bisposaL

] waTER sHuT-OFF

1 omer:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco Production Company requests a change of operator on this well, in addition to the wells on the attached list from Gasco
Production Company to Badlands Production Company, effective date of 4/16/2015.

Gasco Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite 11
Denver CO 80237

303-996-1805 M i

Michael Decker, Exec. Vice President & COO

Badlands Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite,115
Denver CO 80237
303-996-1805 -

Michael Decker, Exec. Vicd President & COO

RECEIVED
JUN 02 2015

DIV, QF OIL, GAS & MINING

APPROVED

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) LjLndsey C°°ks rme Engineering Tech
SIGNATURE ‘ ( ﬁl@/ oate 9/18/2015
(This space for State use only)
JAN 2 2 2016
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

| V. OlL GAS & MINING -
BYWM\&



Well Name

FEDERAL 332-30-9-19

WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19

FEDERAL 12-17-9-19

GATE CYN 31-21-11-15

WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15

WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16

WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-11-17
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08

GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17
RYE PATCH FED 22-21

RYE PATCH FED 24-21

RBU 5-11D

FEDERAL 7-25A

RBU 6-2D

NGC 33-18)

RBU 13-2D

RBU 16-3D

RBU 10-11D

RBU 8-10D

RBU 15-3D

RBU 12-12D

RBU 2-10D

RBU 3-15D

RBU 3-12D

STATE 7-36A

FEDERAL 34-29
FEDERAL 24-7 #1

FEDERAL 23-29 #1

FED 24-20-9-19

FED 44-20-9-19

FED 23-21-9-19

FED 32-31-9-19

FED 42-29-9-19

PETES WASH 23-12 #1

STATE 4-32B

FED 14-18-2 #1

FED 43-24-3 #1

LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19

FED 11-21-9-19

FED 22-30-10-18

FEDERAL 43-30-9-19

FED 11-22-9-19

FED 42-21-9-19

STATE 24-16-9-19

Section TWN
30 090S
29 1008
23 0908
26 0908
19 090S
17 090S
21 1108
32 1008
20 1108
17 1008
19 1108
32 1008
4 1108
32 1008
29 1008
16 1108
16 1008
29 1008
8 1108
16 1108
20 1008
20 1008
4 1108
22 1108
24 1108
11 1008
25 0908
2 1008
18 090S
2 1008
3 1008
11 1008
10 100S
3 1008
12 100S
10 1008
15 1008
12 1008
36 090S
29 0908
7 1008
29 090S
20 090S
20 090S
21 090S
31 090S
29 090S
12 1008
32 090S
18 1008
24 1008
22 0908
21 0908
30 1008
30 090S
22 090S
21 090S
16 090s

RNG
190E
170E
190E
180E
190E
190E
1S0E
170E
150E
170E
160E
170E
170E
170E
170E
150E
170E
170E
170E
160E
170E
170E
170E
140E
140E
180E
180E
180E
190E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
170E
190E
180E
170E
190E
190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E

API

4304753012
4301333098
4304736915
4304738573
4304739777
4304739800
4301332391
4301332447
4301332475
4301332560
4301332611
4301332619
4301332674
4301332676
4301332679
4301332685
4301332730
4301332773
4301332778
4301332888
4301333081
4301333087
4301333099
4301333437
4301333443
4304730409
4304730624
4304731190
4304731200
4304731280
4304731352
4304731357
4304731364
4304731539
4304731651
4304731801
4304733600
4304733739
4304733741
4304733750
4304733983
4304734111
4304734168
4304734169
4304734199
4304734201
4304734202
4304734286
4304734314
4304734539
4304734551
4304734607
4304734608
4304734924
4304735343
4304735404
4304735405
4304735588

Entity
19650
15941
16556
17201
18344
17202
13787
14033
14417
14726
14439
15649
15537
15242
14033
16082
15243
15370
14802
15098
15714
15807
15920
16919
16367
9005

9030

7075

6155

16267
16268
7053

4955

9965

10688
10784
13213
14492
14244
13174
13182
13441
14150
14140
13601
13641
13455
13492
14440
13491
13726
13640
14151
14280
14202
14203
14928
14418

Mineral
Federal
Federal
Fee
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
State
Federal
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State

Surface Type

Federal
Federal
Fee
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
State
Federal
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal

Federal
State

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal

GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
GwW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW

Status

335532

e Mia- e - B - B - e~ Mia - Mie - Mia- Mo - M - e - Bl - M - B - Bia - Bin - Mie - M - Bhe - e~ M- B - Miet - B - e - e - Mia - M - B - ke - Mia - M- B - B - Bin - e - Mia - M - B - e - ke - M - M - Bin - Mia - Ml - M - Mk - ke - Ml -



FEDERAL 31-21-9-19
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19

LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19

DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18
STATE 12-32-9-19

FEDERAL 12-20-9-19
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19

LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19

DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18

FEDERAL 12-1-10-18

SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19

21
29
31
31
22
14
22

36
32
20
20
30
26
36
36
36
36
36
31
31
31
31
25
19
25
30
25
19
25
30
22
14
36

1008
1008
090S
090S

090S
090S
0908
1008
100S

100S
100S
100S

0908

090S
090S

090S
090S
090S

190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
180E
190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
180E
190E
180E
190E
180E
190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
180E
190E
190E
180E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
190E
190E
180E
180E
180E
190E
180E
180E
190E

4304735606
4304735614
4304735623
4304735624
4304735732
4304735733
4304735808
4304735844
4304735845
4304735995
4304736093
4304736094
4304736095
4304736113
4304736219
4304736220
4304736233
4304736241
4304736242
4304736271
4304736336
4304736368
4304736442
4304736600
4304736719
4304736727
4304736739
4304736740
4304736771
4304736772
4304736817
4304736913
4304736916
4304737115
4304737116
4304737117
4304737132
4304737338
4304737611
4304737612
4304737613
4304737621
4304737622
4304737630
4304737631
4304737646
4304737647
4304737676
4304737677
4304738028
4304738336
4304738337
4304738351
4304738352
4304738353
4304738407
4304738465
4304738469
4304738575

14441
14442
14640
14419
14496
14519
15592
14356
14639
14871
14976
16120
14872
15096
14738
14763
14764
14992
14716
15884
15086
15605
15715
14977
15186
15475
15476
15213
15355
15338
15212
15187
17012
15011
16163
16275
15087
15365
16311
16051
16052
16253
16264
16557
15961
16023
16121
16254
15806
16868
16467
16119
16884
16349
16210
16236
16558
16449
16312

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Fee
Fee
Federal
Federal
State

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Fee
Fee
State
Federal
Federal
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Fee
Fee
Federal
Federal
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LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18
STATE 21-32B

STATE 22-32A

STATE 21-32A

FEDERAL 11-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID)
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19

Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18

22
11
32
32
32
19
25
25
I

19
30
19
30
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30
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36

DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36

WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17
SQUAW CROSSING U §
RBU 4-11D

RBU 2-11D

RBU 6-11D

STATE 2-32B

STATE 9-36A
FEDERAL 13-30B
STATE 13-36A
FEDERAL 16-26A
FEDERAL 31-29

RBU 1-10D

FEDERAL 13-18-9-19
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36
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10
18
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4304738673
4304738896
4304739170
4304739171
4304739172
4304739717
4304739729
4304739730
4304739773
4304740233
4304751280
4304751281
4304752870
4304752872
4304753011
4304753324
4304753325
4304753326
4304753327
4304753328
4301332677
4304730129
4304730718
4304730826
4304731192
4304732221
4304732225
4304733581
4304733598
4304733601
4304733653
4304734312
4304739776

15832
16792
16309
16308
16310
17054
17241
17266
17013
17014
18211
18210
19647
10648
19649
19783
19783
19747
19747
19783
15144
16266
16269
16270
16271
11371
11364
13249
17838
12928
13077
16265
17149
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