
STATE OF UTAH FORM 3
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING AMENDEDREPORT Ü
(highlight changes)

5. MINERALLEASE NO: 6. SURFACE:
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL UT ST ML-47068 State

1A.TYPEOFWORK: DRILL REENTER DEEPEN
7.IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

B.TYPEOFWELL: OIL GAS OTHER SINGLEZONE MULTIPLEZONE
8.UNITorCAAGREEMENTNAME:

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC. PETE'S WASH 32-2
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

P.O. BOX 1910 erry VERNAL STATE UT zie 84078 (435) 789-4120 WILDCAT
4. LOCATIONOF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,LU54 9i & 6 2 ' MERIDIAN:

ATSURFACE: 2049' FNL, 1959' FEL
77 SWNE 2 11S 16E S

AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONE: SAME

14. DISTANCE IN MILESAND DIRECTIONFROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:

31.78 MILESSOUTHEAST OF DUCHESNE, UTAH DUCHESNE
UTAH

15. DISTANCETO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE(FEET) 16. NUMBEROF ACRES IN LEASE: 17. NJMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:

1959' 635
18. DISTANCETO NEAREST WELL(DRILLING,COMPLETED, OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:

APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET)
13,100 JP-0921

21. ELEVATIONS(SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATEDATEWORKWILLSTART: 23. ESTlMATEDDURATION:

6527.1' GRADED GROUND 7/16/2003 AUGUST 31, 2003

24. PROPOSED CASINGAND CEMENTINGPROGRAM

SIZE OF HOLE CASINGSIZE, GRADE, ANDWEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENTTYPE, QUANTITY,YIELD,ANDSLURRYWEIGHT

17 1/2" 13 3/8" H-40 48# 300 SEE 8 POINT PLAN

12 1/4" 9 5/8" J-55 ty.361f SEE 8 POINT PLAN

7 7/8" 4 1/2" HC P-110 11.6# 13,100 SEE 8 POINT PLAN

25. ATTACHMENTS

VERIFYTHE FOLLOWNG ARE ATTACHEDINACCORDANCE WITHTHE UTAHOILANDGAS CONSERVATIONGENERAL RULES:

WELL PLATOR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLINGPLAN

EVIDENCEOF DIVISIONOF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANYOTHER THANTHE LEASE OWNER

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Ed Trotter TITLE Agent

SIGNATURE DATE 6/16/2003

(This space for State use on! )
Approvedby the
Utah Division of

API NUMBERASSIGNED: A AGBS and Mining RECEIVED
Date: AÑ'NAS

(11/2001) (See Instruc gnRevers de)

DIVOF OIL,GAS&



TiiS, Ri6E, S.L.B.&M. EOG RESOURCES, INC. ·

Well location, PETE'S WASH #32- 2, located as'co co shown in the SW 1/4 NE 1/4 of Section 2, ·

T11S, R16E, S.L.B.&M. Duchesne County, Utah.1909 Brass Cap
1.2' High

S 1 4 Cor JST10S I AST - (G.L.O.) NB9°56'JO"W 2640.J1' (Meas.) NB9°58'07"W 26J7.44' (Meas.) Brass Cap, 1.1' High

TiiS "s,...cap, t.o
_j

ses·sso;·wd c.c. rooseros, BASIS OF ELEVATIONHigh, Pi/e of Stones 1218.19' (Meas.) Cap, 1.2' High
SPOT ELEVATIONLOCATED AT A HILL TOP IN THE NW 1/4
OF SECTION 2, T11S, R16E, S.L.B.&M. TAKENFROM THEo WILKINRIDGE QUADRANGLE,UTAH, DUCHENSE COUNTY,7.5LOT 4 LOT 3 LOT 2 LOT 1 MINUTEQUAD. (TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE
UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL
SURVEY. SAID ELEVATIONIS MARKED AS BEING 6879 FEET.

PE1E'S WASH/J2--2
NElev. Ungraded Ground = 6528

1 J' High
o o - o

SCALE

CERTIFICATEo
THIS IS TO CERTlFY THAT THE ABOVE PLAT WAS PREgARED FROM
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUALSURVEYS MADE BŸ MÈÖR UÀDER MY
SUPERVISIONAND THAT THE SAME ARE TRUE AND ORRECT TO THE
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND

RI GSTEÀËAND.SURV
REGISTRATION,NO 61

ÜNTAH &GINEERING & I.AND RVEYINGS89 58'W - 80.06 (G.L.O.)
BS SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078

BASIS OF BEARINGS (435) 789-1017
LEGEND: BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION- SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:

1" = 1000' 05--23-03 | 06-02-03L_=
so· SYMBOL (AUTONOMOUS NAD 27) PARTY REFERENCESO = PROPOSED WELL HEAD- LATITUDE =

39°53'15.38" (39.887606) B.B. R.D. D.R.B. G.L.O. PLAT
A = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGITUDE= 110°05'18.42" (110.088450)

WEATHER

WARM G RESOURCES,



From: Ed Bonner
To: Mason, Diana
Date: 7/29/03 2:55PM
Subject: Well Clearence

The following well has been given cultural resource clearence by the Trust Lands Cultural Resources
Group:

EOG Resources, Inc
Pete's Wash 32-2

If you have any questions regarding this matter please give me a call.

CC: Baza, John; Garrison, LaVonne; Hill,Brad; Hunt,



O
EIGHT POINT PLAN

PETE'S WASH 32-2
SWINE, SEC. 2, T11S, R16E, S.L.B.&M.

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

1. & 2. ESTIMATED TOPS & ANTICIPATED OIL, GAS, & WATER ZONES:

FORMATION DEPTH (KB)
Wasatch 4626'
Dark Canyon 8841'
KMV Cret. Price River 9142'
KMV Middle Price River 10,169'
KMV Lower Price River 10,899'
KMV Castlegate 11,345'
Base of Castlegate Sandstone l1,673'
Sunnyside 11,929'
Kenilworth 12,184'
Aberdeen 12,388'
Spring Canyon 12,894'

EST. TD: 13,100 Anticipated BHP 5700 PSI

3. PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT: BOP Schematic Diagram attached.

4. CASING PROGRAM:
RATING FACTOR

HOLE SIZE INTERVAL LENGTH g WEIGHT GRADE THREAD COLLAPSE BURST TENSILE
17 1/2" 0' - 300'+/- KB 300' +/- 13 3/8" 48.0 # H-40 ST&C 770 PSI 1730 PSI 322,000#
12 1/4" 300' - 4000'+/-KB 4000'+/- 9 5/8" 40.0# J-55 ST&C 2570 PSI 3950 PSI 452,000#
7 7/8" 3500' - TD +/-KB 13,100' +/- 4 1/2" 11.6 # HC P-110 LT&C 8650 PSI 10,690 PSI 279,000#

All casing will be new or inspected.

5. Float Equipment:

Surface Hole Procedure (0-300'Below GL):
Guide Shoe
Wooden wiper plug
Centralizers: 1 - 5-10' above shoe, every collar for next 3 joints(4 total).

Intermediate Hole Procedure (300'-4000'):
Guide Shoe
Insert Float Collar (PDC drillable)
Cents.: 1-5' above shoe, top of jts. #2 and #3 then every 5thjOinÍÍO surface. (15 total)

8 point plan-EOG



O
EIGHT POINT PLAN

PETE'S WASH 32-2
SWINE, SEC. 2, T11S, R16E, S.L.B.&M.

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

Float Equipment(Continued):

Production Hole Procedure (4000'-TD):
FS, 1 jointof casing, FC, and balance of casing to surface. Run 11.6#, P-110 burst rating or equivalent
marker collars or short casing joints at ±9100' (top of Price River) and ±4100' (500' above top of
Wasatch). If marker collars are used, alter depth if needed to avoid placing across any potentially-
productive intervals. Centralize 5' above shoe on joint #1, top of joint #2, then every 2nd joint to 400'
above top of shallowest potentially-productive zone. Thread lock FS, top and bottom of FC, and top of
2ndjOint.

6. MUD PROGRAM

Surface Hole Procedure (0-300'below GL):
Air - Air Water Mist

Intermediate Hole Procedure (300'-4000'):
Water (circulate through reserve pit) with Gel/LCM sweeps.

Production Hole Procedure (4000'-TD):
4000'- 9100' Reserve pit water with 6.0 ppg DAP. Circulate through reserve pit with Gel/LCM and

PHPA sweeps as needed.

9100'-TD Close in pits. "Mud up" with PHPA and Seamud for viscosity. Utilize PAC-R for fluid
loss control. Let DAP concentration drop to and maintain 5.5 pob. Do not mix caustic or lime.
Maintain 7.5-8.5 pH. Weight up system with barite and add vis with PHPA and Seamud as hole
conditions require. Run LCM sweeps periodically to seal off loss zones or more often as hole
dictates. Water loss: 20 cc's maximum. Expect increasing gas shows requiring heavier mud
weights from the top of the Price River onward. Treat CO2 contamination with DESCO CF if
mud properties dictate.

7. VARIANCE REQUESTS:

A. EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring a straight run blooie line (Where
possible, a straight run blooie line will be used).

B. EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring an automatic ignitor or
continuous pilot light on the blooie line. (Not required on aerated water system).

B. EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring the blooie line to be 100' in length.
To reduce location excavation, the blooie line will be 75' in length.

8 point plan-EOG



O
EIGHT POINT PLAN

PETE'S WASH 32-2
SWINE, SEC. 2, T11S, R16E, S.L.B.&M.

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

8. EVALUATION PROGRAM:
Logs: Schlumberger Platform Express with Di-pole Sonic from TD to base of surface casing in 1 run.

Rotary sidewall cores as needed and based upon results from first log run.

9. CEMENT PROGRAM:

Surface Hole Procedure (0-300'Below GL)

Lead: 360 sx. (100% excess volume) Class 'G' cement with 2% S1 (CaCl2) & 0.25 pps D29
(cellophane flakes), mixed at 15.8 ppg, 1.15 cu. ft./sk., 4.95 gps water.

Top Out: Top out with Class 'G' cement with 2% S1 (CaC12)in mix water, 15.8 ppg, 1.15 cu. ft./sk.,
4.95 gps via 1" tubing set at 25' if needed.

Intermediate Hole Procedure (300'-4000')

Lead: 240 sx. (50% excess volume) Class 'G' lead cement (coverage from 3000-1000')
with 5% D44 (Salt), 12% D20 (Bentonite), 1% D79% (Extender), 0.25% Dl12
(Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2% D46 (Anti-Foamer) & 0.25 pps D29 (Cellophane flakes)
mixed at 11.0 ppg, 3.91 ft3/sk., 24.5 gps water.

Tail: 290 sx. (50% excess volume) Class 'G' cement (coverage from 4000-3000') with
10% D53 (Gypsum), 2% Sl (CaCl2) & 0.25 pps D29 (Cellophane flakes) mixed at 14.2
ppg, 1.61 ft3/sk., 7.9 gps water.

Production Hole Procedure (4000' to TD)

Lead (Scavenger): 100 sx. 35:65 Poz G w/ 4% D20 (Bentonite), 2% Dl74 (Extender), 0.2% D65
(Dispersant), 0.2% D46 (Antifoamer), 0.75% D112 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.15 % Dl3 (Retarder), 0.25
pps D29 (cellophane flakes), mixed at 13.0 ppg, 1.75 cu. ft./sk., 9.19 gps water.

Middle: Estimated 350 sx. 50:50 Poz G (coverage from 12000-10500') w/ 2% D20 (Bentonite), 0.1%
D46 (Antifoamer), 0.15% Dl3 (Retarder), 0.2% Dl67 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant),
mixed at 14.0 ppg, 1.29 cu. ft./sk., 5.9 gps water.

Tail: Estimated 210 sx. 50:50 Poz G (coverage from 13100-12000') w/ 2% D20 (Bentonite), 35.0% D-

66 (Silica), 0.1% D46 (Antifoamer), 0.075% D800 (Retarder), 0.2% Dl67 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2%
D65 (Dispersant), mixed at 14.1 ppg, 1.53 cu. ft./sk., 7.0 gps water.

8 point plan-EOG



O
EIGHT POINT PLAN

PETE'S WASH 32-2
SWINE, SEC. 2, T11S, R16E, S.L.B.&M.

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

10. ABNORMAL CONDITIONS:
INTERMEDIATE HOLE (300'-4000')
Potential Problems: Lost circulation below 1800' and minor amounts of gas may be present. Monitor
for and report any hydrocarbon shows and/or water zones

PRODUCTION HOLE (4000'-TD)
Potential Problems: Research indicates that mud losses are possible throughout all of
the 7-7/8" hole. Have a variety of LCM particle sizes on location in ample supplies to cover
your needs. At the same time, formation pressures in productive zones could require up to l 1.0
ppg mud weights to control. Sloughing shales and keyseat development are possible in the
Wasatch Formation. CO2 contamination in the mud is possible in the Price River (Mesaverde).

11. STANDARD REQUIRED EQUIPMENT:

A. Choke Manifold
B. Kelly Cock
C. Stabbing Valve
D. Visual Mud Monitoring

12. HAZARDOUS CHEMICALS:

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA title III in an amount equal to or greater than 10,000 pounds
will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in association with the drilling of this well.
Furthermore, no extremely hazardous substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities,
will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling of this well.

(Attachment: BOP Schematic Diagram)

8 point plan-EOG



EOG Resources, Inc.
P.O. 1910

Vernal, UT 84078

June 16, 2003

Utah Division of Oil, Gas, & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

RE: APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL
PETE'S WASH 32-2
SW/NE, SEC. 2, Tll S, R16E
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH
LEASE NO.: UT ST ML-47068
UTAH STATE LANDS

Enclosed please find a copy of the Application for Permit to Drill and associated
attachments for the referenced well.

Please address further communication regarding this matter (including approval) to:
Ed Trotter
P.O. Box 1910
Vernal, UT 84078
Phone: (435)789-4120
Fax: (435)789-1420

Sincerely,

'Ed Tr er
Agent
EOG Resources, Inc.

Attachments

RECEiVED

JUNf 92003
Div.0F OIL,GAS&MINING

Pete's Wash 32-2



EIGHT POINT PLAN

PETE'S WASH 32-2
SWINE, SEC. 2, T11S, R16E, S.L.B.&M.

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

1. & 2. ESTIMATED TOPS & ANTICIPATED OIL, GAS, & WATER ZONEF: O

FORMATION DEPTH (KB)
Wasatch 4626' fr
Dark Canyon 8841'
KMV Cret. Price River 9142'
KMV Middle Price River 10,169'
KMV Lower Price River 10,899'
KMV Castlegate 11,345'
Base of Castlegate Sandstone 11,673'
Sunnyside 11,929'
Kenilworth 12,184'
Aberdeen 12,388'
Spring Canyon 12,894' 77

EST. TD: 13,100 / Anticipated BHP 5700 PSI

3. PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT:/BOP Schematic Diagram attached.

4. CASING PROGRAM: 77
RATING FACTOR

HOLE SIZE INTERVAL LENGTH g WEIGHT GRADE THREAD COLLAPSE BURST TENSILE
17 1/2" 0' - 300'+/- KB 300' +/- 13 3/8" 48.0 # H-40 ST&C 770 PSI 1730 PSI 322,000#
12 1/4" 300' - 3500'+/-KB 3500'+ -"

' 9 5/8" 36.0# ' J-55 ST&C 2020 PSI 3520 PSI 394,000#
7 7/8" 3500' - TD +/-KB 13,10, +/- 4 1/2" 11.6 # HC P-110 LT&C 8650 PSI 10,690 PSI 279,000#

All casing will be new or inspe d.

5. Float Equipment:

Surface Hole Pro¢edure (0-300'Below GL):
Guide Shoe
Wooden wiper ug
Centralizers: - 5-10' above shoe, every collar for next 3 joints (4 total).

Intermediaá Hole Procedure (300'-3500'):
Guide Shool
Insert Flo Collar (PDC drillable)
Cents.:

,

-5' above shoe, top of jts. #2 and #3 then every 5thjOinÍÍO Surface. (15 total)

8 point plan-EOG



EIGHT POINT PLAN

PETE'S WASH 32-2
SWINE, SEC. 2, T11S, R16E, S.L.B.&M.

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

Float Equipment(Continued):

Production Hole Procedure (3500'-TD):
FS, 1 joint of casing, FC, and balance of casing to surface. Run 11.6#, P-110 burst ratifíg or equivalent
marker collars or short casing jointsat ±9100' (top of Price River) and ±4100' (50Wibovetop of
Wasatch). If marker collars are used, alter depth if needed to avoid placing acrpii any potentially-
productive intervals. Centralize 5' above shoe on joint #1, top of joint #2, t,hénevery 2nd jointto 400'
above top of shallowest potentially-productive zone. Thread lock FS, top nd bottom of FC, and top of
2ndJOinÍ.

6. MUD PROGRAM

Surface Hole Procedure (0-300'below GL):
Air - Air Water Mist

Intermediate Hole Procedure (300'-3500'):
Water (circulate through reserve pit) with Gel/LCÑI sweeps.

Production Hole Procedure (3500'-TD):
3500'- 9100' Reserve pit water with 6.0ppg DAP. Circulate through reserve pit with Gel/LCM and

PHPA sweeps as needed.

9100'-TD Close in pits. "Mud up" with PHPA and Seamud for viscosity. Utilize PAC-R for fluid
loss control. Let DAP concentration drop to and maintain 5.5 pob. Do not mix caustic or lime.
Maintain 7.5-8.5 pH. feightup system with barite and add vis with PHPA and Seamud as hole
conditions require. n LCM sweeps periodically to seal off loss zones or more often as hole
dictates. Water loá: 20 cc's maximum. Expect increasing gas shows requiring heavier mud
weights from the/fop of the Price River onward. Treat CO2 contamination with DESCO CF if
mud propertiey'dictate.

7. VARIANCE REQUESTS:

A. EOG Resourcýà, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring a straight run blooie line (Where
possible, a spfaight run blooie line will be used).

B. EOG Re urces, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring an automatic ignitor or
contin us pilot light on the blooie line. (Not required on aerated water system).

B. EO Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring the blooie line to be 100' in length.
To/reduce location excavation, the blooie line will be 75' in length.

8 point plan-EOG



EIGHT POINT PLAN

PETE'S WASH 32-2
SWINE, SEC. 2, T11S, R16E, S.L.B.&M.

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

8. EVALUATION PROGRAM:
Logs: Schlumberger Platform Express with Di-pole Sonic from TD to base of surface ca ng in 1 run.

Rotary sidewall cores as needed and based upon results from first log run.

9. CEMENT PROGRAM: yb

CONFllENTIAL/e
Surface Hole Procedure (0-300'Below GL) { 4

Lead: 360 sx. (100% excess volume) Class 'G' cement with 2% SI (Ca 2) & 0.25 pps D29
(cellophane flakes), mixed at 15.8 ppg, 1.15 cu. ft./sk., 4.95 gps water.

Top Out: Top out with Class 'G' cement with 2% S1 (CaCl2) in ix water, 15.8 ppg, 1.15 cu. ft./sk.,
4.95 gps via 1" tubing set at 25' if needed.

Intermediate Hole Procedure (300'-3500')

Lead: 180 sx. (50% excess volume) Class 'G' lead c ent (coverage from 2500-1000')
with 5% D44 (Salt), 12% D20 (Bentonite), 1% D79°o (Extender), 0.25% D112
(Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2% D46 (Anti-Foamer) 0.25 pps D29 (Cellophane flakes)
mixed at 11.0 ppg, 3.91 ft3/sk., 24.5 gps water.

Tail: 290 sx. (50% excess volume) Class ' cement (coverage from 3500-2500') with
10% D53 (Gypsum), 2% S1 (CaCl2) & 0. pps D29 (Cellophane flakes) mixed at 14.2
ppg, 1.61 ft3/sk., 7.9 gps water.

Production Hole Procedure (3500/to TD)

Lead (Scavenger): 100 sx. 35: Poz G w/ 4% D20 (Bentonite), 2% DI74 (Extender), 0.2% D65
(Dispersant), 0.2% D46 (Anti amer), 0.75% Dl12 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.15 % D13 (Retarder), 0.25
pps D29 (cellophane flakes mixed at 13.0 ppg, 1.75 cu. ft./sk., 9.19 gps water.

Middle: 50:50 Poz G 2% D20 (Bentonite), 0.1% D46 (Antifoamer), 0.15% D13 (Retarder), 0.2%
Dl67 (Fluid Loss Ad ive), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant), mixed at 14.0 ppg, 1.29 cu. ft./sk., 5.9 gps water.

Tail: 50:50 Poz 2% D20 (Bentonite), 35.0% D-66 (Silica), 0.1% D46 (Antifoamer), 0.075% D800
(Retarder), 0.2 167 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant), mixed at 14.1 ppg, 1.53 cu. ft./sk.,
7.0 gps water.

10. ABNOR CONDITIONS:
INTERlŠDIATE HOLE (300'-3500')
Potenti Í Problems: Lost circulation below 1800' and minor amounts of gas may be present. Monitor
for an report any hydrocarbon shows and/or water zones

8 point plan-EOG



O OEIGHT POINT PLAN

PETE'S WASH 32-2
SW/NE, SEC. 2, T11S, R16E, S.L.B.&M.

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

11. ABNORMAL CONDITIONS (Continued):

PRODUCTION HOLE (3500'-TD)
Potential Problems: Research indicates that mud losses are possible throu out all of
the 7-7/8" hole. Have a variety of LCM particle sizes on location in ampl supplies to cover
your needs. At the same time, formation pressures in productive zones ould require up to l 1.0
ppg mud weights to control. Sloughing shales and keyseat develop nt are possible in the
Wasatch Formation. CO2 contamination in the mud is possible in t Price River (Mesaverde).

11. STANDARD REQUIRED EQUIPMENT:

A. Choke Manifold
B. Kelly Cock NÛ
C. Stabbing Valve
D. Visual Mud Monitoring

12. HAZARDOUS CHEMICALS:

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA,1 le III in an amount equal to or greater than 10,000 pounds
will be used, produced, stored, transported, or dis sed of annually in association with the drilling of this well.
Furthermore, no extremely hazardous substance , as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities,
will be used, produced, stored, transported, or isposed of in association with the drilling of this well.

(Attachment: BOP Schematic Dia )

8 poin lan-EOG



5000 PSIG DIAGRAM

ANNULAR PREVENTOR AND BOTH RAMS ARE 5000 PSIG RATED.
CASING FLANGE IS 11" 5000 PSIG RATED ROTATING HEAD
BOPE 11" 5000 PSIG

TESTING PROCEDURE: FLOW LINE
1. BOPE's will be tested with a professional tester to conform to Onshore Order #2 ( )

with retest every 14 days.
2. Blind & Pipe rams will be tested to rated working pressure, 5000 psig. l - I
3. Annular preventor will be tested to 50% of working pressure, 2500 psig.
4. Casing will be tested to 0.22 psi/ft. or 2500 psig. Not to exceed 70% of burst ANNULAR

strength, whichever is greater. PREVENTER
5. All lines subject to well pressure will be pressure-tested to the same pressure as

blind & pipe rams.
6. All BOPE specifications and configurations will meet Onshore Order #2

requirements for 5000 psig BOPE specifications.

PIPE RAMS
CHOKE MANIFOLD

2" MIN ADJUSTABLE CHOKE

TO MUD/GAS SEPARATOR
OR PIT BLIND RAMS

A 3" MINIMUM RATED I O |
5000 PSIG

3" MINIMUM LL LINE

BLEED LINE TO PIT 3" DIAMETER:

CASING
2" MINIMUM FLANG

SPOOL 11" 5000 PSIG

TO MUD/GAS SEPARATOR ADJUSTABLE CHOKE
OR



O O

EOG RESOURCES, INC.
PETES WASH #32-2

SECTION 2, T11S, R16E, S.L.B.&M.

PROCEED IN A SOUTHWESTERLY DIRECTION FROM MYTON, UTAH ALONG
HIGHWAY 40 APPROXIMATELY 1.5 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD
AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTH; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHERLY, THEN SOUTHWESTERLY, THEN SOUTHERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 1.7 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTH; PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY, THEN
SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 9.9 MILES TO THE JUNCTION
OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTH; TURN RIGHT AND
PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY, THEN SOUTHEASTERLY, THEN SOUTHERLY
DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 6.6 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD
AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTH; PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY, THEN
SOUTHWESTERLY, THEN SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 5.9
MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE
WEST; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A WESTERLY, THEN NORTHERLY
DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 1.8 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD
AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHWEST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN
A SOUTHWESTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 2.5 MILES TO THE
BEGINNING OF THE PROPOSED ACCESS TO THE SOUTH; FOLLOW ROAD
FLAGS IN A SOUTHERLY, THEN NORTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.1
MILES TO THE PROPOSED LOCATION.

TOTAL DISTANCE FROM MYTON, UTAH TO THE PROPOSED WELL LOCATION
IS APPROXIMATELY 29.9



O O
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

FOR THE SURFACE USE PROGRAM OF THE
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company/Operator: EOG Resources, Inc.
Well Name & Number: Pete's Wash 32-2
Lease Number: UT ST ML-47068
Location: 2049' FNL & 1959' FEL, SW/NE, Sec. 2,

T11S, R16E, S.L.B.&M.,
Duchesne County, Utah

Surface Ownership: STATE OF UTAH

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Location Construction - forty-eight (48) hours prior to construction
of location and access roads.

Location Completion - prior to moving on the drilling rig.

Spud Notice: - at least twenty-four (24) hours prior to
spudding the well.

Casing String and
Cementing - twenty-four (24) hours prior to running

casing and cementing all casing strings.

BOP and related
Equipment Tests - twenty-four (24) hours prior to running

casing and tests.

First Production
Notice - within five (5) business days after new

Well begins or production resumes after
Well has been off production for more than
ninety (90) days.

For more specific details on notification requirements, please check the Conditions of
Approval for Notice to Drill and Surface Use Program.

Pete's Wash 32-2 D



THIRTEEN POINT SURFACE USE PROGRAM

1. EXISTING ROADS

A. See attached Wellsite Plats showing directional reference stakes on location,
and attached TOPO Map "B" showing access to location from existing roads.

B. The proposed well site is located approximately 31.78 miles southeast of
Duchesene, Utah - See attached TOPO Map "A" .

C. Refer to attached Topographic Map "A" showing labeled access route to
location.

D. Existing roads will be maintained and repaired as necessary. No off lease
Right-of-Way will be required.

2. PLANNED ACCESS ROAD

A. The access road will be approximately 400 feet in length. See attached TOPO
Map "B".

B. The access road has a 30 foot ROW w/ 18 foot running surface.
C. Maximum grade on access road will be 8%.
D. No turnouts will be required.
E. Road drainage crossings shall be of the typical dry creek drainage crossing

type.
F. No culverts, bridges, or major cuts and fills will be required.
G. The access road will be dirt surface.
H. No gates, cattleguards, or fences will be required or encountered.

New or reconstructed roads will be centerlined - flagged at time of location
staking.
All travel will be confined to existing access road Right-of-Way. Access roads
and surface disturbing activities will conform to standards outlined in the Bureau
of Land Management and Forest Service Publication: Surface Operating
Standards For Oil & Gas Exploration and Development, (1989).

The road shall be upgraded to meet the standards of the anticipated traffic flow
and all-weather road requirements. Upgrading shall include ditching, drainage, graveling,
crowning, and capping the roadbed as necessary to provide a well-constructed safe road.
Prior to upgrading, the road shall be cleared of any snow cover and allowed to dry
completely. Traveling off the 30 foot Right-of-Way will not be allowed.

Road drainage crossings shall be of the typical dry creek drainage crossing type.
Crossings shall be designed so they will not cause siltation or accumulation of debris in
the drainage crossings nor shall the drainages be blocked by the roadbed. Diverting water
off at frequent intervals by means of cutouts shall prevent erosion of drainage ditches by
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run off water. Upgrading shall not be allowed during muddy conditions. Should mud
holes develop, they shall be filled in and detours around them avoided.
As operator, EOG Resources, Inc. shall be responsible for all maintenance on
cattleguards, or gates associated with this oil and/or gas operation.

3. LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHIN A ONE MILE RADIUS OF
PROPOSED WELL LOCATION

None-See attached TOPO map "C".

4. LOCATION OF EXISTING AND/OR PROPOSED FACILITIES

A. ON WELL PAD

1. Production facilities will be set on location if the well is successfully
completed for production. Facilities will consist of well head valves,
separator, dehy, 210 Bbl condensate tank, meter house and attaching
piping.

2. Gas gathering lines - A 3" gathering line will be buried from dehy to
the edge of the location.

B. OFF WELL PAD

1. Proposed location of attendant off pad flowlines shall be flagged prior
to archaeological clearance.

2. A 3" OD steel above ground natural gas pipeline will be laid
approximately 8976' from proposed location to a point in the NE/SW
of Section 36, T10S, R16E, where it will tie into QuestarPipeline
Co.'s existing line. Approximately 2640' of the proposed pipeline
crosses State of Utah administered lands.

3. Proposed pipeline will be a 3" OD steel, welded line laid on the
surface.

4. Proposed location of attendant off pad flowlines shall be flagged prior
to archaeological clearance.

5. Protective measures and devices for livestock and wildlife will be
taken and/or installed where required.

If storage facilities/tank batteries are constructed on this lease, the
facility/battery or the well pad shall be surrounded by a containment dike
of sufficient capacity to contain, at a minimum, the entire contents of the
largest tank within the facility/battery, unless more stringent protective
requirements are deemed necessary by the authorized officer.

The production facilities will be placed on the Northeast side of the
location.

Pete's Wash 32-2 D
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5. LOCATION & TYPE OF WATER SUPPLY

A. Water supply will be from the Ouray Municipal Water Plant at Ouray, Utah,
and/or Target Trucking Inc.'s water source in the SW/SW, Section 35, T9S,
R22E, Uintah County, Utah (State Water Right #49-1501). Produced water
from the Chapita Wells and Stagecoach Units will also be used.

B. Water will be hauled by a licensed trucking company.
C. No water well will be drilled on lease.

6. SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL

A. All construction material for this location and access road will be of native
borrow and soil accumulated during the construction of the location.

B. No mineral materials will be required.

7. METHODS OF HANDLING WASTE DISPOSAL

A. METHODS AND LOCATION
1. Cuttings will be confined in the reserve pit.
2. A portable toilet will be provided for human waste during the drilling

and completion of the well. Disposal will be at the Vernal sewage
disposal plant.

3. Burning will not be allowed. Trash and other waste material will be
contained in a wire mesh cage and disposed of at the Uintah County
landfill.

4. Produced wastewater will be confined to a lined pit or storage tank for
a period not to exceed 90 days after initial production. After the 90
day period, the produced water will be contained in a tank on location
and then disposed of at one of the following three locations: Natural
Buttes Unit 21-20B SWD, Ace Disposal, or EOG Resources, Inc.
drilling operations (Chapita Wells Unit, Natural Buttes Unit &
Stagecoach Unit).

5. All chemicals will be disposed of at an authorized disposal site. Drip
pans and absorbent pads will be used on the drilling rig to avoid
leakage of oil to the pit.

B. Water from drilling fluids and recovered during testing operations will be
disposed of by either evaporating in the reserve pit or be removed and
disposed of at an authorized disposal site. Introduction of well bore
hydrocarbons to the reserve pit will be avoided by flaring them off in the flare
pit at the time of recovery.

The reserve pit will be constructed so as not to leak, break, or allow discharge.
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8. ANCILLARY FACILITIES
A. No airstrips or camps are planned for this well.

9. WELLSITE LAYOUT
A. Refer to attached well site plat for related topography cuts and fills and

cross sections.
B. Refer to attached well site plat for rig layout and soil material stockpile

location as approved on On-site.
C. Refer to attached well site plat for rig orientation, parking areas, and

access road.

The reserve pit will be located on the West side of the location. The flare
pit will be located downwind of the prevailing wind direction on the North
side of the location, a minimum of 100 feet from the well head and 30 feet
from the reserve pit fence.
The stockpiled topsoil will be stored East and West of Corner #1.

Access to the well pad will be from the Southwest.

Corners #2, #6, & #8 will be rounded off to minimize excavation.

FENCING REQUIREMENTS:

All pits will be fenced according to the following minimum standards:

A. Thirty-nine inch net wire shall be used with at least one strand of barbed wire
on top of the net wire. (Barbed wire is not necessary if pipe or some type of
reinforcement rod is attached to the top of the entire fence).

B. The net wire shall be no more than 2 inches above the ground. The barbed
wire strand shall be 3 inches above the net wire. Total height of the fence
shall be at least 42 inches.

C. Corner posts shall be cemented and/or braced in such a manner as to keep the
fence tight at all times.

D. Standard steel, wood, or pipe posts shall be used between the corner braces.
Maximum distance between any two posts shall be no greater than 16 feet.

E. All wire shall be stretched by using a stretching device before it is attached to
the corner posts.

The reserve pit fencing will be on the three sides during drilling operations and on
the fourth side when the rig moves off the location. Pits will be fenced and
maintained until clean-up.
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10. PLANS FOR RESTORATION OF SURFACE

A. PRODUCING LOCATION
Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area will be
cleared of all unused tubing, equipment, debris, materials, trash, and junknot
required for production.
Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons on the pit shall be

removed in accordance with CFR 3162.7-1.
If a plastic nylon reinforced liner is used, it shall be torn and perforated before
backfilling of the reserve pit.

I1. SURFACE OWNERSHIP
Access road: State of Utah
Location: State of Utah

12. OTHER INFORMATION
A. EOG Resources, Inc. will inform all persons in the area who are associated

with this project that they are subject to prosecution for knowingly disturbing
historic or archaeological sites, or for collecting artifacts. If historic or
archaeological materials are uncovered during construction, the operator will
immediately stop work that might further disturb such materials, and contact
the AO. Within five working days the AO will inform the operator as to:

-whether the materials appear eligible for the National Register of Historic
Places;

-the mitigation measures the operator will likely have to undertake before
the site can be used.

-a time frame for the AO to complete an expedited review under 36 CFR
800.11 to confirm, through the State Historic Preservation Officer, that the
findings of the AO are correct and that mitigation is appropriate.

If the operator wished, at any time, to relocate activities to avoid the
expense of mitigation and/or the delays associated with this process, the
AO will assume responsibility for whatever recordation and stabilization
of the exposed materials that may be required. Otherwise, the operator
will be responsible for mitigation costs. The AO will provide technical
and procedural guidelines for the conduct of mitigation. Upon verification
from the AO that required mitigation has been completed, the operator will
then be allowed to resume construction.
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LESSEE'S OR OPERATOR'S REPRESENTATIVE AND CERTIFICATION

PERMITTING AGENT DRILLING OPERATIONS
Ed Trotter Donald Presenkowski
P.O. Box 1910 EOG Resources, Inc.
Vernal, UT 84078 P.O. Box 250
Telephone: (435)789-4120 Big Piney, WY 83113
Fax: (435)789-1420 Telephone: (307)276-4865

All lease or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full
compliance is made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil and Gas
Orders, the approval plan of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees.
EOG Resources, Inc. is fully responsible for the actions of their subcontractors. A
copy of these conditions will be furnished to the field representative to insure
compliance.

Certification

I hereby certify that I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the
proposed drillsite and access route; that I am familiar with the conditions that presently
exist; that the statements made in the Plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and
correct; and that the work associated with the operations proposed herein will be
performed by EOG Resources, Inc. and its contractors and subcontractors in conformity
with this Plan and the terms and conditions under which it is approved.

Date A nt
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O EOG RESOURCES, INC.
LOCATIONLAYOUT FOR
PETE'S WASH #32-2

SECTION 2, T11S, R16E, S.L.B.&M.
2049' FNL 1959' FEL
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EOG RESOURCES, INC.

o TYPICALCROSS SECTIONS FOR
×-section PETE'S WASH #32-2

scale SECTION2, T11S, R16E, S.L.B.&M.
50, 2049' FNL 1959' FEL

DATE: 06--03-03
Drawn By: 0.R.B.

65' 135'

Preconstruction
Finished Grade

STA. J+25

26' 135'

LOCAT/0N STAKE

CÙT
ll! /ÍL

STA. 1+50

15' 75 36 135'

Slope= 1 1/2: 1

126 135'

STA. 0+00

APPROXIMATE YARDAGES
EXCESS MATERIALAFTER

(6") Topsoil Stripping = 1,4JO Cu. Yds. 5% COMPACTION = 3,090 Cu. Yds.

Topsoil & Pit Backfill = J,090 Cu. Yds.
Remaining Location = 9,340 Cu. Yds. (1/2 Pit Vol.)

TOTAL CUT = 10,770 CU.YDS. EXCESS UNBALANCE = 0 Cu. Yds.
(After Rehabilitation)

FILL = 7 JOO CU.YDS.
UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
86 So. 200 kast * Vernal. Utah 84078 * (435)



PROPOSED LOCATION:
PETE'S WASH #32-2 nd

LEGEND: EOG RESOURCES, INC.
O PROPOSED LOCATION N PETE'S WASH #32-2

SECTION 2, T11S, R16E, S.L.B.&M.
2049' FNL 1959' FEL

- Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying T 0 POGR A PH I C 5 3 03
85 South 2OO East Vernal, Utah 84O78 M A P DAY YEAR

(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
SCALE:1:100,000 DRAWNBY:K.G. REVISED:



PIPELINE TAP

1.50+/- MILES

Tiõ S
PROPOSED LOCATION:
PETE'S WASH #32-2

2

LEGEND: EOG RESOURCES, INC.
--------------- PROPOSED ACCESS ROAD N PETE'S WASH #32-2

EXISTING ROAD SECTION 2, T11S, R16E, S.L.B.&M.
PROPOSED PIPELINE 2049' FNL 1959' FEL

- Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I c 5 30 0385 South 2OO East Vernal, Utah 84078 M A P MO DAY YEAR(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
SCALE:I" = 2000' DRAWNBY:K.G. REVISED:
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EOG RESOURCES, INC.

PETE'S WASH #32-2
LOCATED IN DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

SECTION 2, T11S, R16E, S.L.B.&M.

PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #5 TO LOCATION STAKE CAMERA ANGLE: SOUTHEASTERLY

PHOTO: VIEW FROM BEGINNING OF PROPOSED ACCESS CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHERLY

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying LOCATIONPHOTos 5 3 03 PHOTO
85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 MONTH DAY YEAR

- smeeiÑM -

435-789-1017 uels@uelsinc.com TAKENBY:B.B. DRAWNBY:K.G. REVISED:



PREOPOSEDSLHOC4TION:

LEGEND: EOG RESOURCES, INC.
----------- ruorost:n.wn:ss no.ru N PETE'S WASH #32-2

EXISTING ROAD SECTION 2, Tl1S, R16E, S.L.B.&M
2049' FNL 1959' FEL

Uintati Engineering & Land Surveying T 0 P 0 GR A PH I C 5 Š 03- 85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 AÍ Å Ë DAY YEAR
(435) 789-1011 * FAX (435) 789-1813

SCALE:I" = 2000' DRAWNBY:K.G. REVISED:00-0



PROPOSED LOC4TION
PETE'S W4SH #32-2

LEGEND: EOG RESOURCES, INC.
gf DISPOSAL WELLS WATER WELLs N PETE'S WASII #32-2
O PRODUCING WELLS ABANDONED WELLS SECTION 2, T115, RI6E, S.L.B.&M.

SHUT IN WELLS * TEMPORARELY ABANDONED 2049' FNL 1959' FEL

M Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying T 0 POGR A PB 1 C 5 30 03
85 South 200 East Vernal, LTtah 84078 M A P MONTH BW mR

(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
SCALE:1"=20W DRAWNBY:K.G.



WORKSHEET

0 0 3 - PLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 06/19/2003 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-013-32453

WELL NAME: PETES WASH 32-2

OPERATOR: EOG RESOURCES INC ( N9550 )

CONTACT: ED TROTTER PHONE NUMBER: 435-789-4120

PROPOSED LOCATION:
INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /

SWNE 02 110S 160E

SURFACE: 2049 FNL 1959 FEL Tech Review Initials Date

BOTTOM: 2049 FNL 1959 FEL
Engineering

DUCHESNE

WILDCAT ( 1 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 3 - State Surface

LEASE NUMBER: UTSTML-47068

SURFACE OWNER: 3 - State LATITUDE: 39.88765

PROPOSED FORMATION: CSLGT LONGITUDE: 110.08856

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

\/ Plat R649-2-3.

v/ Bond: Fed[] Ind[] Sta[3] Fee[]
Unit

080. JP-0921 )
$Í Potash (Y/N) v R649-3-2. General

AA Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception
Q¾o.49-1501 )

/ RDCC Review /N)
Drilling Unit

Board Cause No:' (Date: )F Eff Date:
U R' Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS: Q¾ ÍU-Û

STIPULATIONS: )/ \
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DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

STATEMENT OF BASIS

OPERATOR: EOG Resources Inc
WELL NAME & NUMBER: Pete's Wash 32-2
API NUMBER: 43-013-32453
LOCATION: 1/4,1/4 SW/NE See: 2 TWP: 11S RNG: 16E 2049' FNL 1959' FEL

Geology/Ground Water:

EOG proposes to set 300 feet of surface casing cemented to the surface. The base of the moderately saline
water is estimated at 4,000 feet. A search of Division of Water Rights records shows no water wells within a
10,000 foot radius of the center of section 2. The surface formation at this location is the Uinta Formation.
The surface material at this location is Quaternaryalluvium derived from the Uinta Formation. This material
may contain near surface groundwater. The Uinta Formation is made up of discontinuous sands interbedded
with shales and are not expected to produce prolific aquifers. The proposed surface casing should adequately
protect any near surface aquifers.

Reviewer: Brad Hill Date: 07-17-03

Surface:

The Roosevelt Field Office performed an onsite on said date to look at surface issues and take input from
interested parties. Ed Bonner with SITLA was notified and invited to participate by email on July 07, 2003 and was
not able to attend; Floyd Bartlett with UDWR was also invited by the division and was present to provide
reclamation seed mix for surface area and address wildlife concerns. Bartlett stated during the onsite that UDWR
doesn't have any wildlife concerns with this location. Bonner was told he might have to install a culvert on the new
access road into location from the southwest if a low water crossing does not work for the trucks. We also spoke
about rounding corner #6 and diverting drainage to east and west around location; furthermore, those diversions
should be tied back into the same shallow wash system below location. Surface sand and underlying cobbles (and
because well is in a wash) indicates a liner should be installed in reserve pit. This well was staked as a legal location
and no other issues were brought up during onsite meetina.

Reviewer: Dennis L. Ingram - Date: July 14, 2003

Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill:

1. A 12 mil or thicker synthetic liner shall be used to line reserve pit to prevent seepage into sandy
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WEST RIVERBEND UNIT
TERMINATED

TIOS R16E
T11SRI6E

PETES WASH 32-2

I

OPERATOR: EOG RESOURCES INC. (N9550)

SEC. 2 T.llS, R.16E

FIELD: WILDCAT (001)
COUNTY: DUCHESNE

SPACING: R649-3-2 / GENERAL SITING

Unit Status
WellsGASINJECTION EXPLORATORY Utah 0\\ Gas and Mining

- GAS STORAGE GAS STORAGE
LOCATION ABANDONED NF PP OIL
NEW LOCATION NF SECONDARY Field Status N• PLUGGED & ABANDONED

PENDING ABANDONED
• PRODUCING GAS
· PRODUCING OIL PI OIL ACTIVE

SHUT-IN GAS PP GAS COMBINED
· SHUT-IN OIL
× TEMP. ABANDONED PP GEOTHERML INACTIVE
o TEST WELL PP OIL PROPOSED
s WATER INJECTION SECONDARY
· WATER SUPPLY STORAGE PREPARED BY: DIANA MASON

WATER DISPOSAL TERMINATED TERMINATED S DATE:
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ON-SITE PREDRILL EVALUATION

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

OPERATOR: EOG Resources Inc.
WELL NAME & NUMBER: Pete's Wash 32-2
API NUMBER: 43-013-32453
LEASE: UT ST ML-47068 FIELD/UNIT: WILDCAT
LOCATION: 1/4,1/4 SW/NE Sec:_2 TWP: 11S RNG: 16E 2049' FNL 1959' FEL
LEGAL WELL SITING: 460 F SEC. LINE; 460 F 1/4,1/4 LINE; 920 F ANOTHER WELL.
GPS COORD ('UTM): X =577930 E; Y =4415475 N SURFACE OWNER: SITLA (STATE)

PARTICIPANTS
Dennis L. Ingram (DOGM) Floyd Bartlett (UDWR) Ed Trotter (EOG

Resources)

REGIONAL/LOCAL SETTING & TOPOGRAPHY

Well site has been proposed in semi-desert big sage country and PJ
country on northern side of Pete's Wash, which has a dry sand/qravel
bottom and existing two-track up same. This wash is a broad open canyon
that provides drainage from the southwest to northeast and along that
direction to the Sand Wash Road. Sheep Wash and Wilkin Ridge are both
located less than two miles north of this drainage.

SURFACE USE PLAN

CURRENT SURFACE USE: wildlife use and sheep pasture

PROPOSED SURFACE DISTURBANCE: Proposed 400 feet of new access road plus
2.5 miles

LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHIN A 1 MILE RADIUS: None within one 1
mile area.

LOCATION OF PRODUCTION FACILITIES AND PIPELINES: Eguipment on location
for gas well but pipeline route not given.

SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL: Native cut and fill

ANCILLARY FACILITIES: None requested in APD

WASTE MANAGEMENT PLAN:

Was submitted to the division with Application to Drill

ENVIRONMENTAL PARAMETERS

AFFECTED FLOODPLAINS AND/OR WETLANDS: well on north side of Pete's Wash
and out of bottom but could see flash flood water from storm.

FLORA/FAUNA: Semi desert big sagebrush habitat with sagebrush,
greasewood, needle thread grass, wheatgrass, globe mallow, kochia.
Primary antelope range with rabbits, coyote, bobcat with smaller mammals
and birds present.

SOIL TYPE AND CHARACTERISTICS: Tan to light brown fine-grained sandy
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SURFACE FORMATION & CHARACTERISTICS: Uinta Formation

EROSION/SEDIMENTATION/STABILITY: Active erosion, minor sedimentation, no
stability problems anticipated.

PALEONTOLOGICAL POTENTIAL: None observed during onsite

RESERVE PIT

CHARACTERISTICS: Proposed uphill and in cut on west side of location
measuring 75'x 147'x 12' deep and upwind of wellhead.

LINER REQUIREMENTS (Site Ranking Form attached): 30 points

SURFACE RESTORATION/RECLAMATION PLAN

Reshape and contour location and reserve pit back to original
condition unless otherwise authorized by Sitla at time of reclamation.
Stock pile topsoil and brushy debris together and utilize it for
reclamation effort on reserve pit when closed and remaining material on
location when pluqqed and reclaimed. A seed mixture was given to Ed
Trotter for surface area by Floyd Bartlett with the Utah Division of
Wildlife Resources as 15 pounds per acre, and includes 3# Siberian
wheatgrass; 2# Russian wildrye; 1# Indian ricegrass; ¼ Sand dropseed; 2#
Crested wheatgrass; ½# Needle and threadgrass; 21/2# Thickspike
wheatgrass; ¼# Globe mallow; 2# fourwing saltbrush; 1/23 Forage kochia.

SURFACE AGREEMENT: Yes

CULTURAL RESOURCES/ARCHAEOLOGY: Done by Truesdale and submitted to Sitla

OTHEROBSERVATIONS/COMMENTS

Surface slopes to the east/southeast, a shallow (3' to 4') ditch
across access road, another shallow wash on northeast corner of location
and needs rounded (corner #6),

ATTACHMENTS

Photos of this location were taken and placed on file.

Dennis L. Ingram July 10, 2003 10:00 A.M.
DOGM REPRESENTATIVE
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Ev uation Ranking Criteria and Ranking Score
For Reserve and Onsite Pit Liner Requirements

Site-Specific Factors Ranking Site Ranking

Distance to Groundwater (feet)
>200 0
100 to 200 5
75 to 100 10
25 to 75 15
<25 or recharge area 20 unknown

0

Distance to Surf. Water (feet)
>1000 0
300 to 1000 2
200 to 300 10
100 to 200 15
< 100 20 0

Distance to Nearest Municipal
Well (feet)

>5280 0
1320 to 5280 5
500 to 1320 10
<500 20 0

Distance to Other Wells (feet)
>1320 0
300 to 1320 10
<300 20 0

Native Soil Type
Low permeability 0
Mod. permeability 10
High permeability 20 20

Fluid Type
Air/mist 0
Fresh Water 5
TDS >5000 and <10000 10
TDS >10000 or Oil Base Mud Fluid 15

containing significant levels of
hazardous constituents 20 10

Drill Cuttings
Normal Rock 0
Salt or detrimental 10 0

Annual Precipitation (inches)
<10 0
10 to 20 5
>20 10 0

Affected Populations
<10 0
10 to 30 6
30 to 50 8
>50 10 0

Presence of Nearby Utility
Conduits

Not Present 0
Unknown 10
Present 15 0

Final Score 30 (Level I Sensitivity)

Sensitivity Level I = 20 or more; total containment is required.
Sensitivity Level II = 15-19; lining is discretionary.
Sensitivity Level III = below 15: no specific lining is required
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Points of Diversion Page 1 of 2

UTAH DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS
WATER RIGHT POINT OF DIVERSION PLOT CREATED THU, JUL 17, 2003, 8:57 AM

PLOT SHOWS LOCATION OF 0 POINTS OF DIVERSION

PLOT OF AN AREA WITH A RADIUS OF 10000 FEET FROM A POINT
FEET, FEET OF THE CT CORNER,

SECTION 2 TOWNSHIP 11S RANGE 16E SL BASE AND MERIDIAN

PLOT SCALE IS APPROXIMATELY 1 INCH = 4000 FEET

O
NORTH
kkkkkkkk*

*******kk *********

*** kkk

http://nrwrtl.nr.state.ut.us/cgi-bin/wwwplat.exe?rad=10000&ns=&ew=&cor=CT&sec=2&town=llS&range=16E&bem=SL&s...



Points of Diversion Page 2 of 2
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http://nrwrt1.nr.state.ut.us/cgi-bin/wwwplat.exe?rad=10000&ns=&ew=&cor=CT&sec=2&town=11S&range=16E&bem=SL&s...
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MEMORANDUM

DATE: July 10, 2003

TO: Resource Development Coordinating Committee

FROM: Utah Geological Survey, Environmental Sciences and Geologic Hazards
Programs

SUBJECT: UGS comments on RDCC items 2995, 3016.

2995 Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Short Turn Around Drilling Permit
Sec. 2, Tll S, Rl 6E, Duchesne County, Application for Permit to Drill - proposal to drill
a wildcat well the Pete's Wash 32-2 well on State lease ML-47068.

Although we have no paleontological localities recorded in our files for this project area,
the Eocene Uinta Formation is exposed here and has the potential to yield significant
vertebrate paleontological localities. The office of the State Paleontologist therefore
recommends that a paleontological survey be conducted for this project.

3016 Trust Lands Administration, Proposed land sale - PS 7894, Oak Creek Parcel

Geologic hazards at the parcel may include karst features associated with limestone units
in the area. In addition, unpublished data by R.B. Colton of the U.S. Geological Survey
show landslides coinciding with portions of the parcel. Because of the regional scale of
the landslide maps, site-specific studies would be needed to determine the presence or
absence of landslides. The Utah Geological Survey has general hazards information
available at our offices for



STATE ACTIONS
Governor's Office of Planning and Budget

Resource Development Coordinating Committee
P.O. Box 145610

1594 W. North Temple, Suite 3710
SLC, UT 84114-5610

538-5535
1. Administering State Agency 2. Approximate date project will start:

Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210 Upon Approval or July 16, 2003
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

3. Areawide clearinghouse(s) receiving state action: (to be sent out by agency in block 1)

Uintah Basin Association of Governments

4. Type of action: / / Lease /X / Permit / / License / / Land Acquisition

/ / Land Sale / / Land Exchange / / Other

5. Title of proposed action:

Application for Permit to Drill

6. Description:

I EOG Resources, Inc. proposes to drill the Pete's Wash 32-2 well (wildcat) on State lease ML-47068, Duchesne County,
Utah. This action is being presented to the RDCC for consideration of resource issues affecting state interests. The
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining is the primary administrative agency in this action and must issue approval before
operations commence.

7. Land affected (site location map required) (indicate county) - include UTM coordinates where possible
2049' FNL 1959' FEL SW/4, NE/4,

Section 2, Township 11 South, Range 16 East, Duchesne County, Utah

8. Jordan River Natural Areas Forum review - If the proposed action affects lands within the Jordan River Natural
Areas Corridor. N/A

9. Has the local government(s) been contacted? No
If yes,
a. How was contact made?
b. Who was contacted?
c. What was the response?
d. If no response, how is the local government(s) likely to be impacted?

10. Possible significant impacts likely to occur:

Degree of impact is based on the discovery of oil or gas in commercial quantities.

11. Name and phone of district representative from your agency near project site, if applicable:
N/A

12. For further information, contact: . Ignatu e and title of authorized officer

Diana Mason John R. Baza, Associate irector
Phone: (801) 538-5312 Da : June 20,



STATE OF UTAH FORM 3
DEPARTMENTOFNATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL GAS ANDMINING AMENDED REPORT
(highlight changes)

5. MINERALLEASE NO: 6. SURFACE:APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILL UT ST ML-47068 State
1A. TYPE OF WORK: DRILL RE ENTER DEEPEN 7. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:

B. TYPE OF WELL: OIL GAS 2 OTHER SINGLEZONE MULTIPLEZONE
8. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:EOG RESOURCES, INC. PETE'S WASH 32-2
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:P.O. BOX 1910 VERNAL UT 84078 (435) 789-4120 WILDCAT
4. LOCATIONOF WELL (FOOTAGES) (~

11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,5 4 '15 9. CF MERIDIAN:
ATSURFACE: 2049' FNL, 1959' FEL

-yo SWNE 2 11S 16E S
AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONE: SAME

14. DISTANCEIN MILESAND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWNOR POSTOFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:
31.78 MILES SOUTHEAST OF DUCHESNE, UTAH DUCHESNE UTAH

15. DISTANCETO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE(FEET) 16. NUMBEROF ACRES IN LEASE: 17. NJMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THISWELL:
1959' 635

18. DISTANCETO NEAREST WELL(DRILLING.COMPLETED,OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:APPUED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET)

13,100 JP-0921
21. ELEVATIONS(SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATEDATEWORKWILLSTART: 23. ESTIMATEDDURATION:

6527.1' GRADED GROUND 7/16/2003 AUGUST 31, 2003

24. PROPOSED CASINGAND CEMENTINGPROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, ANDWEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENTTYPE, QUANTITY,YlELD,ANDSLURRY WEIGHT

17 1/2" 13 3/8" H-40 48# 300 SEE 8 POINT PLAN
12 1/4" 9 5/8" J-55 36# 3,500 SEE 8 POINT PLAN
7 7/8" 4 1/2" HC P-110 11.6# 13,100 SEE 8 POINT PLAN

25. ATTACHMENTS
VERIFYTHE FOLLOWINGARE ATTACHEDINACCORDANCEWITHTHE UTAHOILAND GAS CONSERVATIONGENERALRULES:

WELLPLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSEDSURVEYOROR ENGINEER COMPLETEDRILLINGPLAN

EVlDENCE OF D1VISIONOF WATER RIGHTSAPPROVALFOR USE OF WATER FORM 5. IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANYOTHER THANTHE LEASE OWNER

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Ed Trotter
TITLE Agent

SIGNATURE DATE 6/16/2003

(This space for State use on! )

API NUMBERASSIGNED: APPROVAL: (N7 R A
(11/2001) (See Instructions on Reverse



TiiS, Ri6E, S.L.B.&M. EOG RESOURCES, INC. •

Well location, PETE'S WASH #32-2, located as
shown in the SW 1/4 NE 1/4 of Section 2,
T11S, R16E, S.L.B.&M. Duchesne County, Utah.1909 Brass Cap

1.2' High
S 1/4 Cor JST10S AST - (G.L.O.) NB9°56'JO"W 2640.J1' (Meas.) NB9°58'07"W 2637.44' (Meas.) Brass Cap, 1.1' High

T11S scoss cap, 7.o sesseo;-wd 'c.c roos e,,,, BASIS OF ELEVATION
High, P//e of Stones 1216.19' (Meas.) Cap, 1.2' High

SPOT ELEVATIONLOCATED AT A HILL TOP IN THE NW 1/4
OF SECTION 2, T11S, R16E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THEo WILKINRIDGEQUADRANGLE,UTAH, DUCHENSE COUNTY, 7.5LOT 4 LOT 3 LOT 2 LOT 1 MINUTEQUAD. (TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE
UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL
SURVEY.SAID ELEVATIONIS MARKED AS BEING 6879 FEET.

PE TE'S WASH /J2-2
NElev. Ungraded Ground = 6528'

1909 Brass Cap
.

1.J' High
o o - o

SCALE

o CERTIFICATE
o

THIS IS TO CERTIFYTHAT THE ABOVE PLAT WAS PREPARED FROM
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUALSURVEYS MADE BY ME OR UÑDER MY
SUPERVISIONAND THAT THE SAME ARE TRUE AND CORRECT TO THE
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND B

REGISTEREDTAND .SURVEYOR'
REGISTRATIONNO. 161g9'
STATE OF UTAH

AH SGINEERING & IAND SJRVEYINGS89°58'W
-- 80.06 (G.L.O.)

85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078
BASIS OF BEARINGS

. (435) 789-1017
LEGEND: BASIS OF BEARINGS 1S A G.P.S. OBSERVATION- SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:

1" = 1000' 05-23-03 06-02-03
.=

90° SYMBOL (AUTONOMOUS NAD 27) PARTY REFERENCES
= PROPOSED WELL HEAD- LATITUDE =

39°53'15.38" (39.887606) R.D. D.R.B. G.L.O. PLAT
A = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGITUDE= 110'05'18.42" (110.088450) WARM G RESOURCES,



16 17
56

PROPOSED LOCATION:
PETE'S WASH #32-2 Sand

LEGEND: EOG RESOURCES, INC.
PROPOSED LOCATION N PETE'S WASH #32-2

SECTION 2, T11S, R16E, S.L.B.&M.
2049' FNL 1959' FEL

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying OPOGR A PH I C 5 3 0385 South 2OO East Vernal, Utah 84078 M A P O DAY YEAR(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813

SCALE:1:100,000DRAWNBY:K.G. REVISED:



07-03 EOG Petes Wash 3
Casing Schematic
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4-1/2" * Production
MW 11. 13100.
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Well name: 07-03 EOG Petes Wash 32-2
Operator: EOG
String type: Surface Project ID:

43-013-32453
Location: Duchesne

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.200 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F

Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 69 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft

Minimum section length: 220 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface

Burst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 2,594 psi
Internal gradient: 0.074 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 2,616 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 9,200 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.500 ppg
Neutral point: 264 ft Next setting BHP: 4,062 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 2,800 ft
Injection pressure 2,800 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft")
1 300 13.375 48.00 H-40 ST&C 300 300 12.59 28.2

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) F (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 128 740 5.793 1730 14 322 22.37 J

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Date: July 23,2003
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STlPULATIONS: NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 300 ft, a mud weight of 8.2 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design willbe that of the
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Well name: 07-03 EOG Petes Wash 32-2
Operator: EOG
String type: Intermediate Project ID:

43-013-32453
Location: Duchesne

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.800 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F

Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 121 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft

Minimum section length: 250 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 1,565 ft

Burst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 2,958 psi
Internal gradient: 0.120 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 3,438 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 9,200 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.500 ppg
Neutral point: 3,476 ft Next setting BHP: 4,062 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 4,000 ft
Injection pressure 4,000 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft')
1 4000 9.625 40.00 J-55 ST&C 4000 4000 8.75 318.2

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 1829 2570 1.406 443& 3950 1.15 160 452 2.83 J

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Date: July 23,2003
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 4000 ft, a mud weight of 8.8 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design willbe that of the
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Well name: 07-03 EOG Petes Wash 32-2
Operator: EOG
String type: Production Project ID:

43-013-32453
Location: Duchesne

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 11.000 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F

Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 248 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 220 ft

Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 10,115 ft

Burst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 1,769 psi
Internal gradient: 0.436 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 7,485 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 10,945 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft')
1 13099 4.5 11.60 HCP-110 LT&C 13099 13099 3.875 303.6

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 7485 8650 1.156 7485 10690 1.43 152 279 1.84 J

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Date: July 23,2003
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemier method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 13099 ft, a mud weight of 11 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design willbe that of the



Stat of Utah0 0 4 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210

Michael O. Leavitt PO Box 145801Governor
Kathleen Clarke Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Executive Director 801-538-5340

Lowell P. Braxton 801-359-3940 (Fax)
Division Director 801-538-7223 (TDD)

July 30, 2003

EOG Resources, Inc.
PO Box 1910
Vernal, Ut 84078

Re: Pete's Wash 32-2 Well, 2049' FNL, 1959' FEL, SW NE, Sec. 2, T. 11 South, R. 16 East,
Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et seq., Utah
Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous
operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date. The API
identification number assigned to this well is 43-013-32453.

Since ly,

Jo R. Baza
ssociate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Duchesne County Assessor
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Operator: EOG Resources, Inc.

Well Name & Number Pete's Wash 32-2

API Number: 43-013-32453
Lease: UTSTML-47068

Location: SW NE Sec. 2 T. 11 South R. 16 East

Conditions of Approval
1. General

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following
actions during drilling of this well:

• 24 hours prior to cementing or testing casing
• 24 hours prior to testing blowout prevention equipment
• 24 hours prior to spudding the well
• within 24 hours of any emergency changes made to the approved drilling program
• prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well

The following are Division of Oil, Gas and Mining contacts and their work telephone
numbers (please leave a voice mail message if the person is not available to take the call):

• Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338
• Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284 (spud)

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. Compliance with the State of Utah Antiquities Act forbids disturbance of archeological,
historical, or paleontological remains. Should archeological, historical or paleontological
remains be encountered during your operations, you are required to immediately suspend
all operations and immediately inform the Trust Lands Administration and the Division
of State History of the discovery of such remains.

5. Compliance with the Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill outlined in
the Statement of Basis. (Copy Attached)

6. Operator shall comply with applicable recommendations resulting from Resource
Development Coordinating Committee review. Statements



O O
Page 2
Conditions of Approval API # 43-013-32453
July 30, 2003

7. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns)
have not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the
"Board"). In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the
operator is requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to
analyze geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data
from surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its
analysis, and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon
which the well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate
order from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such
analysis by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.

8. Production casing shall be cemented to a minimum of±9000 to cover Price River
formation. (Any additional resources found in the Wasatch will need to be protected with



DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: EOG RESOURCES INC

Well Name: PETES WASH 32-2

Api No: 43-013-32453 Lease Type: STATE

Section 02 Township 11S Range 16E County DUCHESNE

Drilling Contractor CRAIG'S RIG # AIR

SPUDDED:
Date 11/17/03

Time 7:00 AM

How ROTARY

Drilling will commence:

Reported by ED TROTTER

Telephone# 1-435-789-4120

Date 11/18/2003 Signed
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STATEOF UTAH OPERATOR ACCT. NO 9550DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS ANDMIN1NG DPERAfDR: EOG Resources, lilc. . FAK: EARLENE RUSSELL

ADDRESS: P.O. BOX250 (801) 359•3940
ENTITY ACTIONFORM - FORM6 BIG PINEY,WYOMING83113

ACTION CURRENT NEW API WELL NAME LOCA110N SPUD EFFECTIVE
CODE ENTlTYNO. ENTITYNO. NUMBER ClQ SEC. TP RG COUNTY DATE DATE

A 99999 Û 43-047-35031 SOUTHCHAPITA3-3 NESE 3 10S 23E DINTAH 11/17/2003

A 99999 Ì 43-047-35032 SOUTH CHAPITA4-3 NESW 3 10S 23E UINTAH 11/20/2003

A 99999 | 2. 43-013-32453 PETES WASH32-2 SWNE 2 118 16E DUCHESNE 10/17/2003 6 -

ACTIONSCODES (See instructions omback of form)
A - Establish new entily for new well (single wellenly) 4 , /
8 - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unitwell) S
C - Re-assign well from one existing ennty to another existing entity ENGINEERING CLERK 12/1/2003
O - Reassign wei Trom one existing entity to a new entity Tide
E - 01her (expFainin comments section)

NOTE Use COMMENTsection to explain wtay each Action Code was selected. PflOne No. (307) 276-4842

RECEIVED

DEC0 12003
DIV.0F OlL, GAS&
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9) ITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November30, 2000
5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU ST ML-47068
Do not use this form for proposals to driH or to re-enter an

abandoned well. Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. 6. If Indian, Allottee or TribeName

SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.
O Qu Well 8 Gas Well O Other PETE'S WASH32-2

2. Name of Operator Contact: ALFREDA SCHULZ 9. API Well No.
EOG RESOURCES, INC. E-Mail:alfreda_schulz@EOGResources.com 43-013-32453

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or ExploratoryP.O. BOX 250 Ph: 307.276.4833 WILDCAT
BIG PINEY, WY 83113

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) I1. County or Parish, and State

Sec 2 T11S R16E SWNE 2049FNL 1959FEL DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT39.88761 N Lat, 110.08845 W Lon

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Acidize O Deepen O Production (Start/Resume) O Water Shut-OffNotice of Intent
Alter Casing O Fracture Treat O Reclamation O Well Integrity

B Subsequent Report O Casing Repair O New Construction O Recomplete g Other
0 Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon

O Convert to Injection 0 Plug Back O Water Disposal
13. Describe Proposed or CompletedOperation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.

If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locations and measuredand true vertical depthsof all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bondunder which the work will be performed or provide the BondNo. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form 31604 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, includingreclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for fmal inspection.)

EOG Resources, Inc. completed the Kenilworthformation in the referenced well as follows:
1. Perforated from 12,423-24', 12,435-37', 12,470-71', 12,475-76', 12,482-83', 12,490-91' &12,497-98' @3 SPF.
2. Fracture stimulated w/1233 bbis gelled water and 168,000#20/40 sand.
3. Flow tested 89 hours out 4-1/2" casing.
4. At 5:00 a.m., 2/15/04, 10/64" choke, FCP 510 psig, 282 MCFD, OBW. Hourlyflow data recorded
and submitted to Bureau of Land Management at Vernal, Utah 2/16/04.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoingis true and correct.
Electronic Submission #28032 verifie· by the BLMWell Information System

For EOG RESOURCES, NC., sent to the Vernal

Name(Printed/Typed) ALFREDASCHULZ Title SR. REGULATORYASSISTANT

Signature (Electronic Submission) Date 02/18/2004

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Apgoved By Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Office

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowinglyand willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

" OPERATOR-SUBMITTED ** OPERATOR-SUBMITTED"
OPERATOR-SUBMITikEIVED

FEB2 02004
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(IUES1588
Applied Technology Services EnergySenim
1230 D Street- Rock Springs. WV 82901 (307)352-7292

Meter Name: PETES WASP DNíUENDAL
Fiel¿ Name: PETEE WASH

Analyst: JOHNSON

Matar Loc. B: PW232 Report Date: 04/01/2004 14:54:00

Cylinder Free: O psiE Sample Date(s); 04/01/2004

Line Pres 4: 3000 psic Flowing Temp:
0° F

Gas Analysis by Chromatograph

NANE MOLE4 BTU SG GPN

Nitrogen 0.0909 0 0.0009 C

Methane 91-834E 929.6994 0.508] O

co2 1.3374 0 0.0203 C

Ethane 4.9562 87.912E 0.0515 1.3247

E28 O O O 0

Propane 1.0962 27.6464 0.0169 0.3018

i-Butane C.2576 6.3963 0.0052 0.0843
n-Botane 0.1795 5.8696 0,0036 0-0566

i-Pontane 0.0793 3.1801 0.002 0.029

O n-Pentane 0.0424 1.7.036 0.0012 0.0154

Hexanes 0.0581 2.7696 0.0015 0.0233

Beptames 0.0458 2.526 0.0016 0.0211

Octanes 0.022 1.3779 0.0009 0.0113
Nonanas O
IÜÈAL TOTAL: 100.0 1071.0596 0.614 1.8682

Gross BTU/Real Cu Ft- @ 60 deg F Gasoline Content

Pressure = 14.73 14.65 15.025 Pressure = 14.73
Dry = 1073.6834 1063.8373 1095.24 Fropane Gym = 0.3018

Sat. = 1056.2194 1050.3723 1077.781E Butane GPM = 0.1408

Actual = 1073.6934 1067.8379 1095.24 14 Gasoline GPM = 0.1103

Real S.G. = 0.61526 0.615272 0.61531 268 Gasoline GPM = 0.1543

Gas Comp. = 0.997556 0.99757 0.997509 Total GEM = 1.8681

Sulfur Content Dewpoints
Mercaptans ppm = N/A H2O g/mmc£ = N/A

H2s ppa = N/A Hydrocarbon °F
= N/A

psic = N/A

Comments:

Dli li lE097li
¯

Enren Oil & Goa Co.: Geeroe MChrice F.C. BOX 1815 Vernal UT 840/6 APR16 2004

EOG - BIG



ST OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
UU DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UT-ST-ML 47068

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IFINDIAN.ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells,or to PETE'S WASH

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL / OTHER PETE'S WASH 32-2

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC 4301332453
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

P.O. BOX 250 BIG PINEY WY y, 83113 (307) 276-3331 WILDCAT
4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 2049 FNL - 1959 FWL COUNTY: DUCHESNE

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SENE 2 11S 16E STATE:
UTAH

. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDiZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwill start: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER: DRILLING

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION OPERATIONS

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see the attached well chronology report for drilling operations from 11/17/2003 to 6/30/2004.

NJDEN\^

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Alfreda Schulz TITLE Sr. Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE 6/30/2004

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
JULO2 2004

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) DWOFOIL,GAS&
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WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT

Report Generated On: 06-30-2004

Well Name PETE'S WASH 32-02 Well Type EXPG Division DENVER

Field KENILWORTH API # 43-013-32453 Well Class 1SA

County, State DUCHESNE, UT Spud Date 12-30-2003 Class Date 06-16-2004

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 13,100/ 13,100 Property # 053287

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD /MD 0/0

KB / GL Elev 6,541/ 6,527

Location Section 2, T11S, R16E, SWNE, 2049 FNL & 1959 FEL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCES, INC WI % 50.0 NRI % 41.75

AFE No 302456 AFE Total DHC / CWC

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #9 Start Date 07-11-2003 Release Date

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #9 Start Date 07-14-2003 Release Date

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #9 Start Date 12-02-2003 Release Date
DRILLING

07-11-2003 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total 50

Cum Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Well Total 50

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days O MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION DATA

2049' FNL & 1959' FEL (SWINE)

SECTION 2, Tl lS, Rl6E

DUCHESNE COUNTY,UTAH

39.887606 LAT, 110.08845 LONG

TD: 13,100' BLACKHAWKFORMATION

TRUE RIG #9

WC/GAS

KENILWORTH PROSPECT

LEASE: UT ST ML-47068

ELEVATION: 6528' NATGL, 6527' PREP GL, 6541' KB (14')

EOG BPO WI: 50%, NRI 41.75%

EOG APO WI: 25%, NRI



Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENlLWORTH Property:053287

12-02-2003 Reported By EDDIE TROTTER

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 303 TVD 303 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU CRAIG'S AIR RIG. SPUDDED 17-1/2" SURFACE HOLE AT 7:00 AM, l1/17/03.

DRILLED 17-1/2" HOLE TO 315' GL. RUN 7 JTS (303.05' GL) OF 13-3/8", 48.0#/FT, H-40, ST&C CASING &
LANDED AT 317.55'KB. RU DOWELL. PRESSURE TESTED LINES & CEMENT VALVE TO 1000 PSIG. MIXED &
PUMPED 20 BBLS GELLED WATER& 10 BBLS WATERFLUSH AHEAD OF CEMENT. MIXED & PUMPED 267
SX CLASS G CEMENT W/l% CACL-2 & 1/4#/SX CELLOFLAKES. MIXED CEMENT AT 15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF
1.15 CF/SX (54.4 BBLS). DISPLACED CEMENT W/40 BBLS WATER & SHUT-IN CASING VALVE. HAD 5 BBLS
CEMENT RETURNS TO SURFACE. RD DOWELL. PREPARED LOCATION FOR ROTARY RIG. WORT. WILL
DROP FROM REPORT UNTIL FURTHER ACTIVITY.

NOTIFIED CAROL DANIELS W/UOGM OF SPUDDING WELL.

12-30-2003 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD . 420 TVD 420 Progress 200 Days 1 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 16:00 10.0 NIPPLE UP DIVERTER, SPACER SPOOL, ROTATINGHEAD, VALVES, & BOOIE LINE TO FLARE PIT.

16:00 19:00 3.0 HOOKED UP FLOW LINE, ADDED 1-1/2' TO FLOW LINE, WELDER BUILT SPOOL TO MAKE IT FIT.

19:00 00:00 5.0 PU BIT, BS, MM, SS, FOUR 8" DC, XO, FIVE 6-1/2" DC.

00:00 04:00 4.0 DRILLED CEMENT 275' TO 320', DRILLED VERY ROUGH WITH A LOT OF TORQUE. FUNCTION DIVERTER &
HYDRAULICED VALVE.

04:00 06:00 2.0 DRILLED FORMATION 320' TO 420', WT 15/20,RPM 60165,PSI 1320, SPM 117 BOTH, GAL 685, FPR 100.
CALLED CAROL DANIELS AT STATEOF UTAH DEPT OF OIL & GAS DIVISION AT 1800 HRS, 12/29/03,GOT
ANSWERING MACHINE, LEFT MESSAGE.

SAFTEY MEETINGS: BE AWAREOF TOTAL SUROUNDINGS & NIPPLING UP BOP STACK
FUNCTION DEVERTER & HYD VALVE,OK.

RIG ON DAYWORK @06:00, 12/29/03.

SPUDDED 12-1/4" HOLE AT 04:00, 12/30/03.

12-31-2003 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total i

MD 990 TVD 990 Progress 570 Days 2 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING
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t Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

CONFIDUIR
Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 DRLG 420' TO 445' {25}, WT 15/20, RPM 60/65, PSI 1350, SPM 111 BOTH PUMPS, GPM 684, FPH 25'.

07:00 07:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @385°, 5°, RAN TWO SURVEY'S, BOTH 5 DEGREES.

07:30 11:30 4.0 DRLG 445' TO 563' {118 '},WT 10,000, RPM 90/89, PSI 1350, SPM 116/103, GPM 684, FPH 29.50'.

11:30 12:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @475', 4°, {90'}.

12:00 12:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE. CK CROWN A MATIC.

12:30 14:30 2.0 DRLG 563'TO 685' {122'}, WT 12,000, RPM 90/89, PSI 1400, SPM l16/103, GPM 684, FPH 61'.

14:30 15:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @565', 4°, {90'}.

15:00 19:00 4.0 DRLG 685' TO 802' {117'}, WT 10,000, RPM 90/89, PSI 1450, SPM l16/103, GPM 684, FPH 29.25'.

19:00 19:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @710', 4°, {145'}.

19:30 24:00 4.5 DRLG 802' TO 896' {94'}, WT 8,000,RPM 90/89, PSI 1350/1500, SPM 116/103, GPM 610, FPH 20.88'.

24:00 00:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @796', 3.1/4° {86'}.

00:30 05:30 5.0 DRLG 896' TO 990' {94'}, WT 8/10', RPM 65/95, PSI 1650/1700, SPM 65/110, GPM 729, FPH 18.80'.

05:30 06:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @890', 23/4°.

SAFTEY MEETINGS ON RUNNING WIRELINE SURVEY

ICY CONDITIONS

RELAYING HAND SIGNALS

01-01-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling i Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 1,870 TVD 1,870 Progress 880 Days 3 MW 8-4 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:30 3.5 DRLG 990' TO 1082' {92'}, WT 8/10,RPM 65/95, PSI 1500/1600, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 26.28'.

09:30 10:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @982 2 DEGREE.

10:00 10:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CHECK CROWN A MATIC.

10:30 13:00 2.5 DRLG 1082' TO 1176' {94'}, WT 12/15, RPM 65/95, PSI 1500/1700, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 37.6'.

13:00 13:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY@ 1076' 1.75 DEGREE.

13:30 17:30 4.0 DRLG 1082' TO 1301, {219'}, WT 15/20, RPM 65/95, PSI 1500/1650, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 54.75'.

17:30 18:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @ 1201' 1.75 DEGREE.

18:00 20:00 2.0 DRLG 1301' TO 1426' {125} WT 25, RPM 65/95, PSI 1500/1650, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 62.5}.

20:00 20:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY@1326', l.5 DEG.

20:30 22:30 2.0 DRLG 1426' TO 1581' {155'} WT 25 RPM 65/95, PSI 1500/1650, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 77.50'.

22:30 23:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY@1481'2-3/4 DEGREE.

23:00 00:00 1.0 DRLG 1581' TO 1675' {94'}, WT 20, RPM 65/120, PSI 1500/1650, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 94'.

00:00 00:30 0.5 SURVEY @1575'2 DEGREE.

00:30 01:30 1.0 DRLG 1675' TO 1706' {31'}, WT 20/25, RPM 65/95, PSI 1500/1650, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 31'.

01:30 02:00 0.5 RIG REPAIR, WORK ON PUMP.

02:00 04:00 2.0 DRLG 1706 TO 1800' {94'} WT 20/25, RPM 65/95, PSI 1500/1650, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 47'.

04:00 04:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY@ 1700' 2-1/4 DEGREE.

04:30 06:00 1.5 DRLG 1800' TO 1870' {70}, WT 20/25, RPM 65/120, PSI 1500/1650/, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 46.66.
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- Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

CONFilENR
SAFETY MEETING ON HORSE PLAY & PICKING PIPE UP OUT OF PIPE TUBS.

01-02-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling * Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 2,670 TVD 2,670 Progress 800 Days 4 MW 8.4 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 DRLG 1870' TO 1925' {55}, WT 20/26, RPM 65/95, PSI 1500/1650, SPM 105/120, GPM 729 FPH 27.50.

08:00 08:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @1820'2-1/4 DEGREE.

08:30 13:00 4.5 DRLG 1925' TO 2081, {156'}, WT 20/25, RPM 65/95, PSI 1500/1650, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 34.66'.

13:00 13:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @1981' 2 DEGREE.

13:30 14:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CHECK CROWN+MATIC, FUNCTION DIVERTER & SCR VALVE, KELLY & FLOOR VALVES.
14:00 17:00 3.0 DRLG 2081' TO 2205' {124'} WT 20/25, RPM 65/95, PSI 1550/1700, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 41.33.

17:00 17:30 0.5 CHANGE OUT LUBICATOR & DRUM WHEEL ON AUTO DRILLER.

17:30 19:30 2.0 DRLG 2205' TO 2268' {63'}, WT 25/30, RPM 65/95, PSI 1550/1700, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 31.50.

19:30 20:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @2164'2 DEGREE.

20:00 00:30 4.5 DRLG 2268' TO 2454' {186} WT 30/35, RPM 65/95, PSI 1600/1730, SPM 106/120, GPM 729, FPH 41.33'.

00:30 01:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @2354' 2DEGREE.

01:00 03:00 2.0 DRLG 2454' TO 2579' {125'} WT 35/40, RPM 65/95, PSI 1650/1770, SPM 106/120, GPM 729, FPM 62.50'.

03:00 03:30 0.5 CHANGE SWAB ON #1 PUMP.

03:30 06:00 2.5 DRLG 2579' TO 2670' {91'} WT 40,000#, RPM 65/95, PSI 1650/1770, SPM 106/120,GPM 729, FPH 36.40'.

SAFETY MEETING ON TAG OUT & LOCK OUT, HOUSE CLEANING, BOILER, STEAM LINES, STEAM
HEATERS.

GREEN RIVER FORMATION, BG GAS 50/100, CONN GAS 100/300, DTGAS 2001500

01-03-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 3,535 TVD 3,535 Progress 865 Days 5 MW 8.4 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 08:30 2.5 DRLG 2670' TO 2766'{96'} WT 40, RPM 63/94, PSI 1650/1770, SPM 106/120,GPM 728, FPH 38.4'.

08:30 09:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @2666' 2 DEGREE.

09:00 12:30 3.5 DRLG 2766' TO 2950' {184'} WT 40, RPM 63/94, PSI 1650/1780, SPM 106/120, GPM 728, FPH 52.57'.

12:30 13:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC, KELLY & FLOOR VALVE.

13:00 21:00 8.0 DRLG 2950' TO 3262' {312}WT 40, RPM 65/95, PSI 1670/1820, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 39'.

21:00 21:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @3162' 1/2 DEGREE.

21:30 06:00 8.5 DRLG 3262' TO 3535 {273'} WT 40 RPM, 63/95, PSI 1650/1850, SPM 102/115, GPM 7035 FPH 32.11'.

FORMATION GREEN RIVER, BG GAS 50-100, CONN GAS 100-300, DT GAS 200-500.
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

CONFilENR
SAFETY MEETING ON WORKING ON PUMPS, GETTlNG PLENTY OF REST BEFORE COMING TO WORK,

GETTIN TO AND FROM WORK SAFELY. ROADS VERY SLIPPERY.

01-04-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling ,
- Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 3,801 TVD 3,801 Progress 266 Days 6 MW 8.4 Vise 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TRIP FOR BIT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:30 2.5 DRLG 3535' TO 3603' {71'} WT 40, RPM 63/95, PSI 1650/1850, SPM 102/115, GPM 735, FPR 28.40'.

08:30 09:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC, FUNCTION DIVERTER & SCR VALVE, KELLY & FLOOR VALVES.

09:00 14:00 5.0 DRLG 3603' TO 3690' {87}WT 40, RPM 63/95, PSI 1650/1850, SPM 1037115,GPM 735, FPH 17.40.

14:00 19:30 5.5 DROP SURVEY,TRIP OUT & IN. HOLE IN GOOD CONDITION, BIT 1/4" OUT OF GAUGE.

19:30 20:00 0.5 WASH & REAM 3610' TO 3690° {80'}, 40 ' OF HOLE OUT OF GAUGE.

20:00 04:30 8.5 DRLG 3690' TO 3801' {111'} WR 10/40 RPM 63/95, PSI 1600/1800, SPM 103/120, GPM 735 FPH 13.03'.

04:30 06:00 1.5 TRIP OUT OF HOLE, BIT QUIT DRILLING.

FORMATION GREEN RIVER, BG GAS 50-100, CONN GAS 100-300, DT GAS 200/300, TRIP GAS 2328.

SAFETY MEETINGS ON BREAKING IN NEW HANDS, TRIPPING.

BIT DRILLED 80'REAL GOOD, HAD SOME TORQUE, SLOWED DOWN TO 5;6'FPH. PULLED IT, BEARING'S
GONE ON NOSE CONE, NOSE CONE GONE, LOOKS LIKE IT WENT INTO WALLAFTER CONNECTION, NO
MORE TORQUE.

01-05-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total !

Cum Costs: Drilling - Completion Well Total

MD 4,000 TVD 4,000 Progress 199 Days 7 MW 8.4 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKRhepth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TRIP OUT FOR LOGS..

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:30 0.5 FINISH TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT #3.

06:30 07:30 LO LAY DOWN MUD MOTOR, CHANGE BITS.

07:30 11:30 4.0 TRIP IN HOLE, HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE.

11:30 13:30 2.0 WASH & REAM 3701' TO 3801' {100'}. WORK PAST JUNK FROM BIT #2.

13:30 23:30 10.0 DRLG 3801' TO 4000' {199} WT 5/50, RPM 60, PSI 1350, SPM 100/105, GPM 665, FPH 19.9'.

23:30 00:30 1 0 CIRC & PUMP HIGH GEL/LCM SWEEP

00:30 Ol:00 0.5 SHORT TRIP 5 STANDS, CHAIN OUT, HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE.

01:00 02:30 1.5 CIRC & PUMP HIGH GEL/LCM SWEEP. SPOT HIGH VIS PILL ON BOTTOM, WAIT ON SCHLUMBERGER CALL.
TRUCK BROKE DOWN ON WAYTO RIG, WENT BACK TO YARD& CHANGED TRUCKS.

02:30 03:00 0.5 DROP SURVEY.

03:00 06:00 3.0 TRIP FOR LOGS. CHAINED OUT 1ST 5 STANDS. SLM, HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE.

FORMATION GREEN RIVER. BG 50-11, CONN GAS 100-300, TG 2328U, DTG 200-300U.
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENlLWORTH Property: 053287

SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING WINEW HANDS, CHANGE OUT TONG & SLIP DIES.

PUSH NOSE CONE OFF TO SIDE, HAD NO MORE TROUBLE WITH IT, CHAINED OUT 5 STANDS SO NOT TO
KNOCK IT LOOSE, HOPE FOR THE BEST.

SCHLUMBERGER TRUCK LOST IT'S LIGHTS ON WAYOUT TO LOCATION, RETURNED TO SHOP & CHANGED
TRUCKS.

01-06-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 4,000 TVD 4,000 Progress 0 Days 8 MW 8.4 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RIG UP TO CIRC

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 12:00 6.0 RIG UP LOGGERS & RUN LOGS W/SCHLUMBERGER. RUN GR TO SURFACE,RESISTIVITY, POROSITY,
DIPOLE SONIC & MICROLOG TO BOTTOM OF SURFACEAT 318'. HOLE PRETTY MUCH IN GAUGE,
LOGGER'S TD AT 3996'.

12:00 13:00 1.0 RIG DOWN LOGGERS.

13:00 13:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC, GREASE CROWN & BLOCKS.

13:30 14:00 0.5 PICK UP BHA.

14:00 17:00 3.0 TRIP IN HOLE TO CONDITION FOR CASING, HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE.

17:00 17:30 0.5 WASH & REAM l15' TO BOTTOM, 5' FILL.

17:30 18:30 1.0 CIRC & CONDITION HOLE FOR LOGS, PUMPED HIGH GEL/LCM SWEEP, SPOTTED GEL SWEEP ON BOTTOM.

18:30 19:00 0.5 PUMPED PILL & CHAlNED OUT 5 STANDS PIPE.

19:00 21:30 2.5 TRIP OUT TO 8" DC, HOLE OK.

21:30 22:30 1.0 LAY DOWN 4 - 8" DC'S, BIT SUB & BIT. RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE.

22:30 06:00 7.5 RIG UP CASERS & RUN 87 JTS OF 9-5/8, 40#, J-55, LT&C CASING, SHOE LANDED AT 3997', INSERT FLOAT AT

3943' KB. INSTALLED ROTATINGHEAD.

TORQUED CASING SHOE TO 5650 FT-LBS, INSTALLED INSERT FLOAT COLLAR, TORQUE 9-5/8" CASING TO
4520 FT-LBS.

HELD SAFETY MEETINGS ON LEAKS & SPILLS, RIGGING UP CASERS. HAD MEETING WITH CASING CREW

ON SAFE WAYTO RUN CASING. EVERYONE WASPRESENT.

FORMATION GREEN, BG GAS.

ROADS VERY SLIPPERY,WATERTRUCKS WERE CHAINED UP STILL STUCK WHILE GOING UP HILL,

CALLED CRAIG'S ROUSTABOUTTO COME AND BLADE ICE OFF ROAD.

07-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling ' Completion Well Total

MD 4,000 TVD 4,000 Progress 0 Days 9 MW 8.4 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: NIPPLE UP BOP STACK

Start End Hrs Activity Description
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property:053287

00NFilER
06:00 08:30 2.5 TRY TO CIRC CASING, WOULDN"T CIRC,/WORK CASING & TRY TO UNPLUG, PUMP PRESSURE UP TO 1600

PSI, CASING JUMPED UP & STARTED CIRC. LOST 15,000#WT ON WT INDICATOR.

08:30 12:00 3.5 CIRC & WAIT ON WIRELINE TO RUN COLLAR LOCATER, TO SEE IF CASING PARTED,

12:00 14:00 2.0 RIG UP WELLSERV INTERVENTION SERVICES & RUN CCL, CASING HAD NOT PARTED.

14:00 14:30 0.5 RIG DOWN WELLLSERV & FRANK'S WESTATES CASERS, LOAD OUT SAME.

14:30 16:00 1.5 RIG UP SCHLUMBERGER CEMENTERS, PRESSURE TEST LINES,TO 3,000#, HELD SAFTEY MEETING ON

CEMENTING.

16:00 18:00 2.0 CEMENT 9 5/8" INTERMEDIATE CASING WITH 315 SKs HILIFT G + ADDS LEAD {YIELD=3.91} H20=24.46

GAL/SK @ l lPPG, 215 SKs10-2 RFC +ADDS TAIL{YIELD=1.61} H20 8.0 GAL/SK @14.1 PPG,DISP W/FRESH
WATER.

18:00 22:00 4.0 WASH TOP 30' CASING & DEVERTER OUT WITH FRESH WATER,NIPPLE DOWN DEVERTER STACK.

22:00 24:00 2.0 SET C-22 CASING SLIPS, CUT OFF 9 5/8 CASING {20.55'}. SET WITH 100,000#.

24:00 01:00 1.0 FINISH NIPPLE DOWN DERVERTER STACK & SET OUT.

01:00 02:30 1.5 NIPPLE UP C-22-EG CASING SPOOL {B SECTION} TEST TO 1500 PSI FOR 10 MINUTES, OK.

02:30 06:00 3.5 PICK UP 11"15,000 BOP STACK, ANNULAR, & ROTATINGHEAD, NIPPLE UP STACK.

06:00

SAFTEY MEETING'S WITH CASER'S ON RUNNING CASING, WORKING AROUND SCHLUMBERGER &
THERE HIGH PRESSURE LINES, MEETING W/ SCHLUMBERGER ON CEMENTING.

CASING PLUGGED WHENON BOTTOM, UNPLUGGED WITH 1600PSI, APPEARED TO HAVE PARTED AS LOST
15,00# ON WT INDICATOR. CK CASING WITH COLLAR LOCATOR,CASING OK/

18 DEGREE THIS MORNING, SNOWING, ROADS SLIPPERY

01-08-2004 (Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: DriHing ' Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion ^^ Well Total

MD 4,173 TVR 4,173 Progress 173 Days 10 MW 8 4 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Ðepth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 fl:00 5.0 NIPPLE UP BOP STACK,ANNULAR, ROTATINGHEAD, CHOKE MANIFOLD & KILL LIÑES.

11:00 19:00 8.0 TEST BOP STACK,TEST PlPE RAMS, BLIND RAMS, CHOKE LINE, KILL LINES, UPPER KELLY,LOWER KELLY,
SAFETY VALVES& CHOKE MANIFOLD TO 5,000#FOR 10 MINUTES, ANNULAR 2600 FOR 10MlNUTES,
CASING 1500#FOR 30 MINUTES, ACCUMULATORPRESSURE 3,000#, MANIFOLD 1500#, ANNULAR PSI 1,000#.

19:00 20:00 1.0 INSTALL WEAR RING & PICK UP BHA.

20:00 22:30 2.5 TRIP IN HOLE W1NEWBIT.

22:30 23:30 1.0 CUT & SLIP 75' DRLG LINE.

23:30 00:30 1.0 DLG CEMENT INSERT FLOAT & SHOE. TAGGEDCEMENT @3954'.

00:30 01:00 0.5 DRLG 4000' TO 4010' {10'}. WT 5,000, RPM 60, PSI 600, SPM 114, GPM 388, FPH 20'.

01:00 02:00 1.0 MIX GEL SWEEP & CIRC TO SURFACE FOR INTEGRITY TEST.

02:00 02:30 0.5 INTEGRITY @4010', 550 PSI FOR 15MINUTES, EMW 11 PPG.

02:30 05:30 3.0 DRLG 4010' TO 4173' {163}. WT 15,000, RPM 60, PSI 750, SPM 115, GPM 391, FPH 54.33.

05:30 06:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @4088', 1-1/2 DEGREE.

SAFETY MEETING ON NIPPLE UP BOP, HOOKING UP HYDRAULICLINES, KEEPING FLOORS & WALKSDRY.

MIX DAP TO 6 PPG.

FORMATION GREEN RIVER, BG 0-5U, CONN 10-50U/BG, TG 80U, DT N/A.

01-09-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 5,306 TVD 4,173 Progress 1,133 Days 11 MW 8.4 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 10:00 4.0 DRLG 4173'TO 4360' {187'}. WT 15,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 810, SPM l19, GPM 405, FPH 46.75.

10:00 10:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE CK CROWN-O-MATIC.

10:30 15:30 5.0 DRLG 4360' TO 4771' {411'}. WT 15,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 810, SPM 120, GPM 408, FPH 82.20'.

15:30 16:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @4600', 1.75 DEGREES.

16:00 02:30 10.5 DRLG 4771' TO 5176' {405'}. WT 13/18, RPM 60/55, PSI 850, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 38.57'.

02:30 03:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @5085', 2 DEGREES.

03:00 06:00 3.0 DRLG 5176'TO 5306' {130'}. WT 18,000, RPM 60/55, PSI 850, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 43.33'.

FORMATION TOP WASATCH 4626' MD.

BG GAS 0-5U, CONN GAS 10-50 U, DT GAS N/A

SAFETY MEETINGS ON CHANGING LINERS & SWABS IN PUMPS, OPERATINGAIR TUGGER & GREASING
RIG.

CIRC RESERVE PIT, DAP 6 PPG.

10 DEGREES, FULL MOON, CHILL.

01-10-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 6,400 TVD 6,400 Progress 1,094 Days 12 MW 8.5 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 09:30 3.5 DRLG 5306' TO 5450' {144}. WT 20,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 871, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 41.14.

09:30 10:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CK CROWNd-MATIC, FUNCTION PIPE RAMS, WORK KELLY & FLOOR VALVES.

10:00 14:30 4.5 DRLG 5450' TO 5669' {219}. WT 20,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 880, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 48.66'.

14:30 15:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @5585', 1.25°.

15:00 01:30 10.5 DRLG 5669' TO 6198' {529']. WT 20,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 900, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 50.38'.

01:30 02:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @6113', 1.25 DEGREE.

02:00 06:00 4.0 DRLG 6198' TO 6400' [202']. WT 20,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 900, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 50.5'.

01-11-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 7,280 TVD 7,280 Progress 880 Days 13 MW 8.5 Visc 25.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD.

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 10:00 4.0 DRLG 6400' TO 6572' [172']. WT 20,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 900, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPR 43'.
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

10:00 10:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CK CROWN-O-MATIC, FUNCTION PIPE RAMS, WORK KELLY & FLOOR VALVES.

10:30 15:30 5.0 DRLG 6572' TO 6759" [187']. WT 20,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 925, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 37.4'.

15:30 16:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @6676', 1-3/4 DEGREE.

16:00 05:00 13.0 DRLG 6759' TO 7256' [49T]. WT 20,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 730/910, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 38.23'.

05:00 05:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @7171', 1-3/4 DEGREE.

05:30 06:00 0.5 DRLG 7256' TO 7280' [24']. WT 20,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 730/910, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 48'.

FORMATION WASATCH TOP 4626', PROJECTED DARK CANYON TOP 8841'.

BG GAS 0-5U, CONN GAS 5-10U/BG, DT GAS N/A, NO SHOWS, 15% SS, 85% SHALE.

SAFTEY MEETINGS ON TRAINING NEW HANDS ON BOP DRILLS, DETECTING H2S GAS.

TWO CREWS HELD BOP DRILLS: 3 MINS 51 SEC & 2 MIN.

4 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, FULL MOON.

01-12-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 7,756 TVD 7,756 Progress 476 Days 14 MW 8.5 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0:0 Perf : PKRDepth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: CUT & SLIP 200' DRLG LINE, TRIP.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 12:00 6.0 DRLG 7280' TO 7508' {228'], WT 20,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 730/960, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 38'.

12:00 12;30 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CK CROWN-O-MATIC, FUNCTION PIPE RAMS, WORK KELLY & FLOOR VALVES.

12:30 20630 8.0 DRLG 7508'TO 7756'(248), WT 20,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 730/960, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 31'.

20:30 21:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY@7672', 1-3/4 DEGREES. PUMP PILL, DRAIN UPFOR TRIP.

21:00 02:00 5.0 TRIP OUT OF HOLE, NO PROBLEM, HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE.

02:00 03100 LO LAY DOWN BIT, CK MUD MOTOR, FUNCTION BLIND & PIPE RAMS, CK CROWN-O-MATIC.

03:00 05:00 2.0 TRIP IN HOLE TO 3906', NO PROBLEMS.

05:00 06:00 1 0 CUT & SLIP 200' DRILLING LINE, BAD SPOT IN LINE.

FORMATIONWASATCH,TOP 4626'. PROJECED DARK CANYON TOP 8841'.

BG GAS 0-5U, CONN GAS 5-10U, DT GAS N/A

NO SHOWS, 25% SS, 75% SHALE

SAFETY MEETINGS ON DETECTING H2S & WHATTO DO IF DETECTED, WORKING ON PUMPS, TRIPPING &
CUTTING DRLG LINE

WEATHER 4 DEGREES & CLEAR.

01-13-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 8,455 TVD 8,455 Progress 699 Days 15 MW 8.6 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:30 2.5 FINISH TRIP IN HOLE, NO PROBLEMS.
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- Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

08:30 09:30 1.0 BREAK CIRC, WASH & REAM 80' TO BOTTOM, 10' FILL.

09:30 12:00 2.5 DRLG 7756' TO 7848' [92']. WT 5/20, RPM 60/53, PSI 800/1050, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 36.80'.
12:00 12:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC.

12:30 00:30 12.0 DRLG 7848' TO 8319' [471'. WT 18/20, RPM 60/53, PSI 850/1050, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 39.25'.

00:30 01:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @8234', 1-3/4 DEG.

01:00 06:00 5.0 DRLG 8319' TO 8455' [136']. WT 16/20, RPM 60/53, PSI 850/1050, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 27.20'.

FORMATION WASATCH TOP 4626', PROJECTED DARK CANYON TOP 8841'.

BG GAS 0-5U, CONN GAS 0-5U, TRIP GAS 22U, DT GAS 5/10U/BG

NO SHOWS, 25% SS, 75% SHALE.

SAFTEY MEETING ON TRIPPING W/NEW HANDS, SLOW DOWN & THINK, KEEPING THINGS THAWED OUT.

WEATHER 4 DEGREE LITE BREEZE.

USED 1026 GALS FUEL.

01-14-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Dillling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,115 TVD 9,115 Progress 660 Days 16 MW 8.6 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 12:00 6.0 DRLG 8455' TO 8630' [175']. WT 16/20', RPM 60/53, PSI 850/1050, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 29.

12:00 12:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CHECKED CROWN-O-MATIC, FUNCTION PIPE RAMS & WORK KELLY & FLOOR VALVES.

12:30 06:00 17.5 DRLG 8630' TO 9115'[485]. WT 20/22, RPM 60/53, PSI 850/950, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 27.71'.

FORMATION: DARK CANYON TOP 8841'. 35% SS, 65% SHALE

BG GAS 0-l0U, CONN 0-5U, DT GAS 5-10U, BGG 5-10U

SAFETY MEETINGS ON WORKING ON MUD PUMPS, A CLEAN RIG IS A HAPPY RIG, KEEPING ICE OFF
FLOORS & WALKWAYS.

WEATHER 4 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLEAR

USED 1203 GAL FUEL.

01-15-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,810 TVD 9,810 Progress 695 Days 17 MW 8.6 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING AT 9810'

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 12:30 6.5 DRLG 9115' TO 9314'[l99']. WT 15/20, RPM 65/70, PSI 800/1000, SPM 125, GPM 425.

12:30 12:45 0.25 RIG SERVICE.

12:45 06:00 17.25 DRLG 9314' TO 9810' [496]. WT 15/20, RPM 55/70, PSI 800/1000, SPM 125,GPM 425.
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• Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

FORMATION PRICE RIVER TOP AT 9157'. 55% SS, 45% SHALE, BG GAS 5-25U, CONN 25-50U/BG, DT GAS 5-
10U, 5-10U BGG.

SAFETY MEETINGS ON HAVING SAFETY CABLES AND CHAINS ON ALL HIGH PRESSURE HOSES.
WEATHER 5 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLEAR SKYS

USED 1043 GALS FUEL.

01-16-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,875 TVD 9,875 Progress 56 Days 18 MW 8.8 Visc 28.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 10:00 4.0 DRLG 9819' TO 9859' [40']. WT 15/20, RPM 55/70, PSI 800/1000, SPM 125, GPM 425.

10:00 12:50 2.8333 PUMPED 30 BELS BRINE AND DROP SURVEY. TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO 4370' WINO DRAG.
333333

12:50 13:15 0.4166 SERVICE RIG.
666667

13:15 16:00 2.75 FINISH TRIP OUT OF HOLE. LAID DOWN DRLG MOTOR AND BIT #5.

16:00 18:15 2.25 PU BIT #6 AND NEW MOTORWITH .16 REVIGAL AND TIH TO 4571'.

18:15 19:30 1.25 SLIP 195'OF DRLG LINE DUE TO BROKEN CABLE STRANDS.

19:30 22:15 2.75 TRIP IN HOLE TO 9250', TAG UP ON TIGHT HOLE.

22:15 05:15 7.0 WASHAND REAM TIGHT HOLE 9250' TO 9454', CONT'D TIH TO 9809' TAG UP ON FILL, WASH50' FILL TO
TD. (REAMING PARAMETERS:WT 5/15, RPM 55/70, PSI 940/1100, SPM 125, GPM 425).

05:15 06:00 0.75 DRLG 9859' TO 9875 {16], WT 15, RPM 55, PSI 1100, SPM 123, GPM 418.

FORMATION PRICE RIVER TOP 915T. 50% SS, 50% SHALE, BG GAS 5--25U, TRIP 136U.

SAFETY MEETINGS ON REAMING DOS AND DON'TS.

WEATHER 5 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLEAR SKY.

USED 1228 GAL FUEL.

01-17-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling 3 i Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total :

MD 10,430 TVD 10,430 Progress 555 Days 19 MW 8.6 Visc 36.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 11:30 5.5 DRLG 9875' TO 10,055'[180], WT 5/18, RPM 68/72, PSI l100, SPM 120, GPM 408.

11:30 12:00 0.5 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE.

12:00 12:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG.

12:30 06:00 17.5 DRLG 10,055' TO 10,430' [375']. WT 12/18, RPM 68/72, PSI 1030/1180, SPM 125, GPM 425.

FORMATION: MIDDLE PRICE RIVER TOP 10,176'. 45% SS, 40% SHALE, 15% COAL, BG GAS 35-65U, CONN 50-
100U/BG, DT GAS 75-150U. 30-70U/BG.
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We11Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

SHOW #1: 10,204, 1.5/2.5/1.2, PEAK 335, BG 40. SHOW #2: 10,220, 1.1/.8/1.4, PEAK 213, BG 60. SHOW #3: 10,245,
1.1/1.7/1.2, PEAK 448, BG 60. SHOW #4: 10,260, 1.3/1.5/1.2, PEAK 236, BG 60. SHOW #5: 10,292, 2.2/2.9/1.9, PEAK
204, BG 60. SHOW #6: 10,320, 2.0/1.9/1.8, PEAK 216, BG 60. SHOW #7: 10,391, 2.6/1.9/1.9, PEAK 451, BG 50.

SAFETY MEETINGS ON IMPORTANCE OF EYE AND EAR PROTECTION,

WEATHER 8 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLEAR SKYS

USED 1365 GAL FUEL.

01-18-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,841 TVD 10,841 Progress 411 Days 20 MW 9.0 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 13:30 7.5 DRLG 10,430' TO 10,549' [119]. WT 10/20, RPM 64/70, PSI l 125/1250, SPM 120, GPM 408.

13:30 14:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG.

14:00 06:00 16.0 DRLG 10,549' TO 10,841', [292']. WT 12/18, RPM 58/65, PSI 1080/1230, SPM l18, GPM 401.

FORMATION: MIDDLE PRICE RIVER TOP 10,176'. 40% SS, 40% SHALE, 20% COAL, BG GAS 35-65U, CONN
100-300U/BG, DT GAS 100-300U.

Show #1: 10,420 3.5/3.0/1.9 224 60 Show #2: 1(),449 2.6/2.5/1.3 346 60 Show #3: 10,581 1.5/2.0/1.4 286 130 Show
#4: 10,656 1.2/0.9/1.5 847 125 Show #5: 10,690 4.0710/2.0 924 65 Show #6: 10,745 1.5/2.171.6 1330 175 Show #7:
10,794 2.3/2.5/3.0 1229 160 Show #8: 10,809 2.2/2.2/2.3 2592 250 Show #9: 10,815 2.9/3.1/3.8 3759 250

01-19-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: DriHing 3 Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,847 TVD 10,847 Progress 6 Days 21 MW 9.2 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTÐ : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TRIP IN HOLE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 09:45 3.75 DRLG 10,841' TO 10,84T [6]. WT 12/20, RPM 55/65, PSI l125/1500, SPM 120, GPM 408.

09:45 16:15 6.5 TRIP FOR BIT #7. LD MUD MOTOR AND BIT #6.

16:15 19:30 3.25 PU BIT #7, NEW MUD MOTOR, 4 DRILL COLLARS AND TIH TO 3970'.

19:30 20:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE, TEST PIPE AND BLIND RAMS WHEN OUT OF HOLE. ALSO TESTED CROWN-O-MATIC.

20:00 24:00 4.0 REPAIRED DRUM ON DRAWWORKS.

24:00 03:00 3.0 TRIP IN HOLE TO 9400' W/NO DRAG.

03:00 05:30 2.5 WASH/REAM FROM 9400' TO9490'.

05:30 06:00 0.5 TRIP IN HOLE TO 9606'.

FORMATION TOPS:

MIDDLE PRICE RIVER AT 10,176'. 45% SS, 45% SHALE, 10% COAL, BG GAS 500U, CONN 100-300U/BG, DT
GAS N/A.
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

SAFETY MEETINGS ON REAMING DO'S AND DON'TS.
WEATHER 8 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLEAR SKY
USED 1100 GAL FUEL.

DAPP CONCENTRATION 5.0 PPG.

01-20-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion ' Well Total

MD 10,996 TVD 10,996 Progress 149 Days 22 MW 9.2 Visc 38.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: TRIP FOR BIT #8

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 10:00 4.0 WASH/REAM FROM 9650' TO 9900'.
10:00 10:30 0.5 TRIP IN HOLE TO 10,680'.

10:30 12:00 1.5 WASHAND REAM 10,680' TO 10,847'.

12:00 15:30 3.5 DRLG 10,847' TO 10,888' [41). WT 35/45, RPM 36/53, PSI 1400/1500, SPM 120, GPM 408.

15:30 16:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE. RUN BOP DRILL.

16:00 03:30 11.5 DRLG 10,888' TO 10,996' [108]. WT 45, RPM 35/58, PSI 1350/1500, SPM 120, GPM 408.

03:30 05:00 1.5 MIX AND PUMP WEIGHTED PILL.
05:00 06:00 1.0 PULL OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT CHANGE.

FORMATION: LOWER PRICE RIVER TOP AT 10,899'. 40% SS, 50% SHALE, 10% COAL, BG GAS 500U, CONN
100-300U/BG, DT GAS 300-500U, TRIP GAS 4009U.

SAFETY MEETINGS ON SIGNS AND DETECTION OF BLOW OUTS.

WEATHER ll DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLEAR SKY.
USED 1200 GAL FUEL.

01-21-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,092 TVD 11,092 Progress 245 Days 23 MW 9.3 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 10:00 4.0 FINISH TRIP OUT OF HOLE LAYING DOWN BIT #7. TEST BLIND RANS, PIPE RAMS, HYDRIL, AND HCR.
10:00 l l:30 l.5 REPAIR DRAWWORKS DRUM.
11:30 18:00 6.5 PU BIT #8 AND TIH TO 10,956'.
18:00 19:30 1.5 WASHAND REAM 10,956' TO 10,996'.

19:30 06:00 10.5 DRLG 10,996' TO 11,092'[96], WT 42/45, RPM 48/53, PSI 1400/1650, SPM 1108, GPM 367.

FORMATION LOWER PRICE RIVER TOP l 1,092'

40% SS, 55% SHALE, 5% COAL

BG GAS 400/600U, CONN 300-500U/BG, DT GAS 500/1000

SAFETY MTG: EYE/EAR PROTECTION

WEATHER 16 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLEAR SKYS
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

USED 1160 GAL FUEL

DAPP CONCENTRATION IS 5.0 PPG

MBT IS OPPG

01-22-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,153 TVD 11,153 Progress 61 Days 24 MW 9.3 Visc 35.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 10:00 4.0 DRLG 11,092' TO 11,102' [10], WT 42/45, RPM 48/53, PSI 1400/1650, SPM 1108, GPM 367.

10:00 16:00 6.0 PULL OUT OF HOLE TO CHECK BOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY, FOUND MUD MOTOR SEIZED UP.
16:00 19:00 3.0 PU BIT #9 AND NEW MUD MOTOR AND TRIP IN HOLE.

19:00 20:30 1.5 SLIP AND CUT 125' OF DRLG LINE.

20:30 00:00 3.5 FINISH TRIP IN HOLE.

00:00 06:00 6.0 DRLG l1,102' TO 11,153'[51), WT 25/45, RPM 48/53, PSI 1100/1200, SPM l10, GPM 367.

01-23-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion f~
Well Total

MD 11,359 TVD 11,359 Progress 206 Days 25 MW 9.4 Visc 36.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 11:00 5.0 DRLG 11,153' TO 11,192'[39], WT 25/45, RPM 48/53, PSI 1100/1200, SPM 110, GPM 367.

11:00 ll:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE.

11:30 06:00 18.5 DRLG 11,192' TO 11,359'[167'). WT 30/45, RPM 50/55, PSI 1200,SPM l15, GPM 391.

FORMATION CASTLEGATETOP 11,358'. 25% SS, 75% SHALE, BG GAS 1500U, CONN 1000-2000U/BG, DT GAS
1000/3000.

SAFETY MEETING ON PROPER RIG GREASING TECHNIQUE.

WEATHER0 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLEAR SKY.

USED 1230 GAL FUEL.

DAPP CONCENTRATION IS 5.2 PPG.

MBT IS 0 PPG.

01-24-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion ' Well Total

MD l l,597 TVD l l,597 Progress 238 Days 26 MW 9.4 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

06:00 14:30 8.5 DRLG l1,359' TO 11,434' [75'/8.8'/HR], WT 40/45, RPM 53/58, PSI 1400, SPM 120, GPM 408,

14:30 15:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE.

15:00 06:00 15.0 DRLG 11,434' TO 11,597' [163'll l'lHR], WT 40/45, RPM 53/58, PSI 1400, SPM 120, GPM 408.

01-25-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling i Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion ~ Well Total

MD 11,761 TVD 11,761 Progress 164 Days 27 MW 10.2 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TRIP FOR BIT #10

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 11:00 5.0 DRLG 11,597' TO ll,648'[51'/10.2'/HR], WT 35/45, RPM 53/58, PSI 1500, SPM 120, GPM 408.

11:00 11:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG, CHECK BLIND RAMS, PIPE RAMS, HYDRIL AND HCR.

11:30 23:00 11.5 DRLG 11,648' TO 11,761' [113'/9.8'lHR), WT 40/45, RPM 53/58, PSI 1500, SPM l 16, GPM 395.

23:00 00:45 1.75 MIX AND PUMP PILL. DROPPED SURVEY.

00:45 06:00 5.25 TRIP FOR BIT #10 TO 1764'.

FORMATION CASTLEGATE TOP EST l1,691', 30% SS, 55% SHALE, COAL 15%.

BG GAS 1500U, CONN 1000-2000U/BG, DT GAS 2000/4000.

SAFETY MEETING ON MIXING AND HANDLING MUD MATERIAL, ALSO MSDS SHEETS.

WEATHER 25 DEGREES, 30-40 MPH WIND, SNOWING

USED 1210 GAL FUEL. DAPP CONCENTRATIONIS 5.0 PPG. MBT IS 2.0 PPG.

01-26-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling & Completion Daily Total '

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,882 TVD 11,882 Progress 12l Days 28 MW 10.4 Visc 40.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TRIP OUT FOR BIT CHECK

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 FINISH TRIP OUT OF HOLE.

07:00 08:00 1.0 LAID DOWN MUD MOTOR AND BIT #9. PU NEW MOTOR AND BIT #10.

08:00 14:00 6.0 TRIP IN HOLE WITH BIT #10. WASHAND REAM 30' TO BOTTOM W/NO FILL.

14:00 16:30 2.5 DRLG l1,761' TO 11,789'[28'/11'lHR), WT 38/42, RPM 48/57, PSI 1540/1680, SPM l15, GPM 391.

16:30 17:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE AND REPAIR ROTARYCHAIN.

17:00 03:45 10.75 DRLG l1,789' TO l1,882' [93'/8.7'/HR], WT 40/45, RPM 53/58, PSI 1500, SPM 120, GPM 408. ROP SLOWED
CONSIDERABLY,PRESSURE & TORQUE INCREASE AT 11882'.

03:45 05:00 1.25 CIRCULATE AND MIXED PILL. DROPPED SURVEY AND PUMP PILL.

05:00 06:00 1.0 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO CHECK BIT & MOTOR.

FORMATION CASTLEGATE TOP EST 11,691'. 40% SS, 55% SHALE, COAL 5%. BG GAS 1500U,CONN 1000-

2000U/BG, DT GAS 2000/4000.

SAFETY MEETING ON USING PROPER CLOTHING.

WEATHER 3 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLEAR SKY
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

USED 1260 GAL FUEL.

DAPP CONCENTRATION IS 5.2 PPG AND MBT IS 3.0 PPG.
01-27-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,913 TVD 11,913 Progress 31 Days 29 MW 10.2 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 11:00 5.0 FINISH TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO COLLARS.
11:00 15:00 4.0 INPECTED COLLARS, LAID DOWN 4 DC'S.
15:00 16:00 1.0 TRIP IN HOLE INSPECTING REMAINING DC'S.

16:00 17:00 1.0 PU 4 MORE DC'S AND CIRCULATED THROUGH BHA.

8

000

9

SLRIPNCHUOLDEPsILL

LINE.

19:00 22:15 3.25 FINISH TRIP IN HOLE.

22:l5 01:00 2.75 WASH AND REAM 80' TO BOTTOM.

01:00 06:00 5.0 DRLG l1,882' TO l l,913'[31', 6.2'/HR]. WT 30/40, RPM 50/55, PSI 1500, SPM l15, GPM 391.

FORMATION CASTLEGATE TOP EST AT 11,691'. 45% SS, 50% SHALE, COAL 5%.

BG GAS 1300U, CONN 1000-2000U/BG, TRIP GAS 9762.

SAFETY MEETING ON CUTTING AND SLIPPING DRILLING LINE.

WEATHER 6 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLEAR SKIES
USED 1220 GALS FUEL.

DAPP CONCENTRATION IS 5.0 PPG. MBT IS 3.0 PPG.

01-28-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total '

MD 12,090 TVD 12,090 Progress 177 Days 30 MW 10.2 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 08:30 2.5 DRLG 11,913' TO l1,927'[14'/5.6'/HR]. WT 30/40, RPM 50/55, PSI 1500, SPM l15, GPM 391.

08:30 09:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG. CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC, PIPE RAMS, HYDRIL, AND HCR.
09:00 17:30 8.5 DRLG l1,927' TO 11,988'[61'/7.2'lHR]. WT 35/42, RPM 50/55, PSI 1550/1630, SPM 115, GPM 391.
17:30 18:00 0.5 REPAIR ROTARY CHAIN.

18:00 06:00 12.0 DRLG 11,988' TO 12,090'[102'/8.5'lHR]. WT 30/40, RPM 50/55, PSI 1600/1680, SPM l15, GPM 391.

FORMATION SUNNYSIDE TOP EST 11,930'. 25% SS, 35% SHALE, COAL 40%
BG GAS 6700U, CONN 2000-3000U/BG, DOWN TIME GAS 2000/4000.

SAFETY MEETING ON HANDLING MUD PRODUCTS.
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

WEATHER 6 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLEAR SKY,USED 1050 GAL FUEL

DAPP CONCENTRATION IS 5.2 PPG.

MBT IS 3.0 PPG.

01 29-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling ' - Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 12,150 TVD 12,150 Progress 60 Days 31 MW 10.2 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:00 3.0 DRLG 12,090' TO 12,111' [21']. WT 30/40, RPM 50/55, PSI 1600/1680, SPM 115, GPM 391, FPH 7'.

09:00 09:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CK CROWN-O-MATIC, FUNCTION PIPE RAMS, WORK KELLY & FLOOR VALES, CK ANNULAR.
09:30 13:00 3.5 DRLG 12,111' TO 12,125'[14']. WT 30/40, RPM 50/55, PSI 1600/1680, SPM 115, GPM 391, FPH 4'.

13:00 20:30 7.5 PUMP PILI & TRIP OUT OF HOLE, HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE.

20:30 21:30 1.0 LAY DOWN .13 MUD MOTOR, PU .16 MUD MOTOR, FUNCTION BLIND RAMS.

21:30 03:30 6.0 TRIP IN HOLE, NO PROBLEMS, HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE, NO FILL.

03:30 06:00 2.5 DRLG 12,125' TO 12,150' [25']. 10FPH, WT 4/5, RPM 50/60, PSI 1500/1590, SPM 115, GPM 396.

FORMATION SUNNYSIDE TOP 11,930', PROJECTED KENILWORTH @12,187'

BG GAS 1700U, CONN GAS 2000-3000/BG, TRIP GAS 8247, DT GAS 2,000-4,000.

NO SHOWS, 25% SS, 45% SHALE, 30% COAL.

VENTED TRIP GAS, 15' TO 20'FLARE

SAFETY MEETINGS ON LOCK OUT-TAG OUT, LAYING DOWN BHA, PROPER CLOTHING.
WEATHER 20 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLOUDY.

USED 1020 GAL FUEL.

01-30-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion ~

Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total i

MD 12,400 TVD 12,400 Progress 250 Days 32 MW 10.2 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 08:30 2.5 DRLG 12,150' TO 12,205' [55']. 22' FPH, WT 5/12,000, RPM 50/60, PSI 1500/1650,GPM 361.
08:30 09:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CK CROWN-OMATIC, WORK PIPE RAM & ANNULAR, FUNCTION HCR.
09:00 06:00 21.0 DRLG 12,205' TO 12,400' [195']. 9.28' FPH, WT 15/22, RPM 50/60, PSI 1550/1800, GPM 361.

SAFETY MEETINGS ON CATHEADS & AIR TUGGER, TRIPPING SHORT HANDED, WORKING WITH
ELECTRICITY

WEATHER NICE, CLEAR & SUNNY

FORMATION SUNNYSIDE, BG GAS 6900U, CONN GAS 2,000/3000U/BG, DT 2000/4000U/BG
30% SS, 45% SHALE, 25% COAL
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

DIVERTED THRU GAS BUSTER FROM 12,340' TO 12,398', 10-15'FLARE WHILE DIVERTING.
3'-10' FLARE WHILE VENTING.

01-31-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling ' Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 12,678 TVD 12,678 Progress 278 Days 33 MW 10.6 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 09:30 3.5 DRLG 12,400' TO 12,454' [54'). 15.42' FPH. WT 10/22, RPM 50/60, SPM 115, PSI 1600/1700, GPM 361.

09:30 10:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CK CROWN-O-MATIC, FUNCTION PIPE RAMS, HCR, WORK FLOOR & KELLYVALVES.
10:00 06:00 20.0 DRLG 12,454' TO 12,678'. 224', l1.20'FPH. WT 14/22, RPM 50/60, SPM l15, PSI 1600/1700, GPM 361.

SAFETY MEETINGS ON HOUSEKEEPING, DRLG WITH UNDER BALANCED MUD, CHANGING OIL.

FORMATION KENILWORTHTOP AT 12,585', ABERDEEN TOP EST AT 12,700'.

DIVERTING GAS THRU GAS BUSTER, ±6'FLARE.

BG GAS 3800U, CONN GAS [GOING THRU BUSTER], DT GAS N/A.

30% SS, 45% SHALE, 25% COAL.

WEATHER CLOUDY. APP 1" NEW SNOW.

FUEL USED 2150 GALS

02-01-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total ~

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 422 Days 34 MW 10.6 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP TO LOG

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 10:30 4.5 DRLG 12,678' TO 12,733'. 55', l2.22' FPH. WT 15/22, RPM 50/60, SPM 115, PSI 1700/1950, GPM 361.
10:30 l1:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CK CROWN-O-MATIC, FUNCTION PIPE RAMS & HCR, WORK FLOOR & KELLYVALVES.
l1:00 06:00 19.0 DRLG 12,733, TO 13'100' TD. 376', 19.31' FPH. REACHED TD @0600 HRS, 02/01/04. WT 14/22, RPM 50/60, SPM

l15, PSI 1700/1900, GPM 361.

SAFETY MEETING ON DRESSING FOR WINTER, SAFETY GLASSES, IMPORTANCE OF BOP DRILLS.
FORMATION ABERDEEN AT 12,667' EST TOP, SPRING CANYONAT±13,100'.

BG GAS 5400, CONN [THRU GAS BUSTER) DT N/A, NO SHOWS.

30% SS, 70% SHALE.

WEATHER CLEAR, CHILLY

FUEL 1400 GALS

02-02-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

Daily Costs: Drilling $ Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling * Completion Well Total ?
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 35 MW 11.0 Visc 42.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOGGING WISCHLUMBERGER.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 CIRC & CONDITION HOLE FOR LOGS.

08:00 09:30 1.5 SHORT TRIP 15 STANDS, HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE.

09:30 10:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CK CROWN-O-MATIC, WORK PIPE RAMS, FUNCTION KELLY & FLOOR VALVES.

10:00 12:00 2.0 CIRC & CONDITION FOR LOGS.

12:00 19:30 7.5 RUN SURVEY. PUMPED WEIGHTED PILL. TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR LOGS. SLM NO CORRECTION. SURVEY

@13,015', 1-3/4 DEGREE.

19:30 06:00 10.5 RIG UP SCHLUMBERGER & LOGGING. RUN CNL, TLD, AIT, PR CAL. LOGGER'S TD 13,114', BHT 196
DEGREE.

FORMATION SPRING CANYON

SAFETY MEETING ON WORKING W/PRESSURE, TRIPPING & LOGGING W/SCHLUMBERGER.

WEATHER CLEAR, CHILLY.

USED 1140 GALS FUEL.

02-03-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling ' Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling '
, Completion

^^ Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 36 MW 11.0 Visc 40.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TOH TO LOG.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 13:00 7.0 LOGGING W/SCHLUMBERGER. RIH WITH DSI/FMI LOG. HIT OBSTRUCTION @10,745'. ATTEMPTED TO
WORK PAST WINO SUCCESS. LOGGED OUT FROM 10,745'.

13:00 14:00 1.0 LAY DOWN LOGGING TOOLS.

14:00 15:00 1.0 RIG SERVICE, CUT & SLIP 110' DRLG LINE.

15:00 20:00 5.0 TIH TO 10,700'.

20:00 21:00 1.0 WASHED & REAMED 10,700' TO 10,780'. BRIDGE @10,745' TOOK 5-10,000# WT TO REAM OUT. WORKED UP
& DOWN SEVERAL TIMES, CLEANED UP REAL GOOD.

21:00 21:30 0.5 TRIP TO BOTTOM.

21:30 22:00 0.5 WASH & REAM 50' TO BOTTOM, NO FILL.

22:00 01:00 3.0 CIRC & CONDITION MUD, LARGE AMOUNT OF CUTTINGS WITH BOTTOMS UP. PUMP 70 SEC/QT VIS
SWEEP,VERY LITTLE INCREASE IN CUTTINGS AT SHAKER WITH SWEEP TO SURFACE. MIXED & SPOTTED
70 SEC/QT VIS PILL TO 10,600'.

01:00 01:30 0.5 PUMP SLUG TO TRIP FOR LOGS.

01:30 06:00 4.5 TRIP OUT FOR LOGS, CHAIN FIRST 25 STANDS OUT.

FORMATION SPRING CANYON.

TRIP GAS 8137U, 20'FLARE AT PEAK OF TRIP GAS, CIRC THRU GAS BUSTER.

SAFETY MEETINGS ON UNLOADING TRUCKS, DRINKING FLUIDS IN COLD WEATHER, ROTATINGHEAD.

WEATHER: WARMEDUP AND SNOWING PRETTY GOOD.

02-04-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property:053287

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Ðaily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

lVÏD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 37 MW 11.0 Visc 40.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TRIP IN HOLE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:30 2.5 TRIP OUT TO LOG.

08:30 20:00 11.5 RIG UP & LOGGING W/SCHLUMBERGER. LOGGERS TD 13,107'. RAN DSI, FMI LOG.

20:00 03:00 7.0 RAN ROTARY CORES W/SCHLUMBERGER, RECOVERED 25 CORES [100%].

03:00 04:00 1.0 RIG DOWN SCHLUMBERGER LOGGERS.

04:00 06:00 2.0 PICK UP BIT & TRIP IN HOLE. PULLED WEAR BUSHING.

RECOVERED CORES FROM 12,887.1', 12,681.7', 12,582', 12556.9', 12,491',12,484', 12,474.9', 12,471', 12437',
12434.9',12403.9',12,309', 12,298.9', 12291', 12274.1', 12,239', 12226.9', 12,128', 12038', 12018.9',12012',11,947',
11,940', 11,706', 11,326.9'.

CORING WENT VERY WELL NO PROBLEMS, HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE.

* CALLED CAROL DANIELS @UOGM. ALSO, INFORMED DENNIS INGRAM OF CASING STRING &
CEMENTING JOBS.

SAFETY MEETING ON BEING AWARE OF YOUR SURROUNDINGS, ICE PLUGS IN DP, STEAM LINES.
WEATHER SNOWING, LITE BREEZE, APP 1-1/2" SNOW

USED 810 GAL FUEL.

02-05-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling i Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total ''~ '¯ ^

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 38 MW 11.0 Visc 40.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUNNING 41/2" CASING.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 10:00 4.0 TRIP TO BOTTOM, NO PROBLEMS.

10:00 13:00 3.0 CIRC & CONDITION MUD FOR CASING, MUD WT 11.1,VIS 45, 10/12' FLARE ON BOTTOMS UP.

13:00 00:30 11.5 PUMP HEAVY PILL TO DRY UP PIPE. LD DRILL PIPE & DRILL COLLARS.

00:30 01:30 l.0 RIG UP CASERS. HELD SAFETY MEETING W/CASING CREW, EVERYONE ATTENTED.

01:30 06:00 4.5 RUN 4-1/2", l l.6#/FT, HCP -110, LTC CASING., OPTIMUM TORQUE 3020 FT-LDS. BREAK CIRC @
INTERMEDIATE CASING SHOE.

SAFETY MEETING ON PULLING WEAR RING, LAYING DOWN DP & PICKING UP CASING.

WEATHER CHILLY SUNNY

02-06-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 39 MW 11.0 Visc 40.0
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 12:00 6.0 RAN 326 JTS OF 4-1/2", l1.6#/FT, HC P-110, LT&C CASING, FLOATSHOE SET @ 13,090', FLOAT COLLAR @
13Q47', 22' MARKER JOINT 9033-9055', 22' MARKER JOINT 4063-4085'KB

. MAKE UP TORQUE 3020 FT-LBS,
CASING WAS CLEANED & ID DRIFTED TO 3.875". RAN BOW-SPRING CENTRALIZER EVRY OTHER JOINT
TD-10600'.

12:00 14:00 2.0 CIRC CASING BEFORE CEMENTING. RECIPROCATEDCASING 38' EVERY 10 MINS, NO TIGHT SPOTS. HAD
O'TO 7' FLARE UNTIL AFTER BOTTOMS UP.

14:00 16:00 2.0 CEMENT W/SCHLUMBERGER. RECIPROCATE 38'UNTIL STARTINGTO DISPLACE W/WATER. STARTED TO
GET TIGHT, SET SHOE AT 13090'. HAD FULL RETURNS THROUGHOUT JOB. BUMPED PLUG TO 3300 PSI, 500
PSI OVER CIRC PRESSURE, FLOATS HELD.

CEMENTED WITH 570 SX (178 BBLS) OF 35/65 POZ G WITH 4% D-20, 2% D-174. 0.2% D-65, 0.2% D-46, 0.75%
D-112, 0.15% D-13, 0.25% D-29. SLURRY WEIGHT 13 PPG,YIELD 1.75 CFS. MIDDLE SLURRY 345 SX (79
BBLS) 50/50 POZ G WITH 2% D-20, 0.2% D-65, 0.2% D-167, 0.1% D-46, 0.075% D-80. SLURRY WEIGHT 14.1
PPG,YIELD 1.29 CFS. TAILED IN WITH 180 SX (49 BBLS) 50/50 POZ G WITH 2% -D20, 0.2% D-65, 0.2% D-167,
0.1% D-46, 0.075% D-80, 35% D-66. SLURRY WEIGHT 14.1 PPG, YIELD 1.53 CFS. HAD FULL RETURNS. TOP OF
LEAD CEMENT ESTIMATED AT 9000', TOP OF MIDDLE SLURRY ESTIMATED AT 10620', TOP OF TAIL
CEMENT ESTIMATED AT 12000'.

16:00 18:30 2.5 RIG DOWN SCHLUMBERGER CEMENTERS, NIPPLE DOWN BOP STACK.

18:30 21:00 2.5 PICKED UP BOP STACK, SET CASING SLIPS, CASING WT WITHOUT BLOCKS 100,000#. SET 4-1/2" CASING
ON SLIPS WITH 100,000#, SLIPS SET OK. CHECKED LEL & 02 LEVELS, CUT OFF CASING, SET BOP BACK
DOWN.

21:00 23:00 2.0 CLEAN MUD TANKS. LAID DOWN KELLY. SIGNED BY TOOL PUSHER & CONSULTANT.

23:00 06:00 7.0 RIG DOWN ROTARYTOOLS & PREPARED TO MOVE TO CWU 828-9. WILL DROP FROM REPORT UNTIL
COMPLETION COMMENCES.

SAFETY MEETING ON RUNNING CASING WITH T&M CASING CREW, EVERYONEATTENDED.

SAFETY MEETING ON CEMENTING WITH SCHLUMBERGER, EVERYONEATTENDED.

SAFETY MEETING ON ND BOP STACK, SETTING SLIPS, CUTTING OFF CASING.

WEATHER NICE

FUEL 1000 GALS.

06:00 RELEASED RIG AT 11:00 PM, 2/5/04.

CAS

02-·10-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion ' Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 40 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN CBL

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 NU TUBING HEAD & BOPE. SET ANCHORS & MOVED IN FRAC TANKS. SDFN. PREP TO RUN CBL

02-11-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Page



Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: K.ENILWORTH Property: 053287

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 41 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,423 - 12,498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PRESSURE BUILD UP

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RU COMPUTALOG WL. RAN CBL/VDL/GR/CCL FROM 13,030' TO 8783'. TOC @8922'±. RU SCHLUMBERGER

TESTED CASING, BOPE & FLOW BACK MANIFOLD TO 8500 PSIG.

PERFORATED KENILWORTH FROM 12,423-24', 12,435'-37', 12,470-71', 12,475'-76', 12,482'-83', 12,490'-91' &
12,497'-98' W/3-l/8" HSC CASING GUN @3 SPF & 120° PHASING. RDWL. NO PRESSURE INCREASE AFTER
PERFORATING. PUMPED 3 BW @4.5 BPM & 5300 PSIG. BREAK DOWN PRESSURE 5419 PSIG. ISIP 4700 PSIG.
RD SCHLUMBERGER. FLOWED BACK 4 BLW. SI. SDFN.

02-12-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling ' Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 42 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,423 - 12,498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC KENILWORTH ZONE

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 3400 PSIG. FLOWED 8 HRS ON AN OPEN CHOKE. FCP 0 PISG. RECOVERED 120 BLW. FLOWED 14 HRS

ON 12/64" CHOKE. AT 6 AM, FCP 80 PSIG. 64 MCFD. NO FLUID. PREP TO FRAC.

3-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total I

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 43 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,423 - 12,498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FCP 80 PSIG. 12/64" CHOKE. NO FLUID. 64 MCFD. RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASING W/5000

GALS YFl25ST PAD, 48,216 GALS YF125ST & YFl20ST, &l68,497#20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. (10 GPM SCALE
INHIBITOR YFl25ST). MTP 8119 PSIG. MTR 42.1 BPM. ATP 6648 PSIG. ATR 36.6 BPM. ISIP 5960 PSIG. RD
SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED 17 HRS. AT 5 AM, 16/64" CHOKE, FCP 550 PSIG, 2-3 BLWPH. RECOVERED 936 BLW, 523 BLWTR.

02-14-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion '
Daily Total I

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total I

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 44 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,423 - 12,498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. AS FOLLOWS:

TIME CHOKE FCP BFPH BLWR BLWTR GAS REMARKS
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

0600 16/64 600 3 939 550 882
0700 16/64 500 3 942 547 735

a
200 9962 7 2

1000 16/64 450 0 962 527 662
1100 16/64 350 0 962 527 515

1200 16/64 350 0 962 527 515

1300 16/64 300 0 962 527 441

1400 10/64 500 0 962 527 277 INSTALLED 10/64" CHOKE @13:30

1500 10/64 550 0 962 527 304
1600 10/64 450 0 962 527 249

1700 10/64 425 0 962 527 235

1800 10/64 500 0 962 527 277

1900 10/64 600 0 962 527 332

2000 10/64 550 0 962 527 304

2100 10/64 525 0 962 527 290

2200 10/64 450 0 962 527 249

2300 10/64 450 3 965 524 249

2400 10/64 575 0 965 524 318
0100 10/64 550 0 965 524 304
0200 10/64 475 0 965 524 263

0300 10/64 400 0 965 524 221

0400 10/64 575 10 975 514 318

0500 10/64 700 0 975 514 387

02-15-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion . Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 45 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,423 - 12,498 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS AS FOLLOWS:

TIME CHOKE FCP BWPH BLWR BLWTR GAS REMARKS
0600 10/64 625 0 975 514 346
0700 10/64 625 0 975 514 346
0800 10/64 550 0 975 514 304
0900 10/64 580 0 975 514 321

1000 10/64 520 0 975 514 288
1100 10/64 480 0 975 514 266

1200 10/64 460 0 975 514 254
1300 10/64 610 2 977 512 333
1400 10/64 550 0 977 512 304
1500 10/64 510 0 977 512 282
1600 10/64 470 0 977 512 260
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

1700 10/64 440 0 977 512 243

1800 10/64 400 0 977 512 221

1900 10/64 430 7 984 505 244

2000 10/64 500 0 984 505 277

2100 10/64 480 2 986 503 265

2200 10/64 460 0 986 503 254

2300 10/64 450 0 986 503 249

2400 10/64 430 0 986 503 238

0100 10/64 400 4 990 499 221

0200 10/64 530 0 990 499 293

0300 10/64 560 0 990 499 309

0400 10/64 500 0 990 499 277

0500 10/64 460 3 993 496 254

02-16-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 46 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,423 - 12,498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS AS FOLLOWS:

TIME CHOKE FCP BFPH BLWR BLWTR GAS REMARKS

0600 10/64 460 0 993 496 254

0700 10/64 390 3 996 493 216

0800 10/64 590 0 996 493 326

0900 10/64 500 0 996 493 277

1000 10/64 420 12 1008 481 232

1100 10/64 530 7 1015 474 293

1200 10/64 550 0 1015 474 304

1300 10/64 580 0 1015 474 321

1400 10/64 440 15 1030 459 243

1500 10/64 360 12 1042 447 199

1600 10/64 580 3 1045 444 321

1700 10/64 780 0 1045 444 431

1800 10/64 790 0 1045 444 437

1900 10/64 780 0 1045 444 431

2000 10/64 580 0 1045 444 321

2100 10/64 580 0 1045 444 321

2200 10/64 510 0 1045 444 282

2300 10/64 500 0 1045 444 277

2400 10/64 430 2 1047 442 238

0100 10/64 370 3 1050 439 205

0200 10/64 460 2 1052 437 254

0300 10/64 620 0 1052 437 343
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- Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

0400 10/64 600 0 1052 437 332

0500 10/64 510 0 1052 437 282

02-17-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 47 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,423 - 12,498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS AS FOLLOWS:

TIME CHOKE FCP BFPH BLWR BLWTR GAS

0600 10/64 430 4 1056 433 238

0700 10/64 490 6 1062 427 271

0800 10/64 470 0 1062 427 260
0900 10/64 420 0 1062 427 232

1000 10/64 410 0 1062 427 227
1100 10/64 320 6 1068 421 177

1200 10/64 420 8 1076 413 232

CAROL SCOTT WITH BLM ON LOCATION TO CHECK CHOKE & CHARTS

1300 10/64 600 2 1078 411 332

1400 10/64 700 0 1078 411 387
1500 10/64 700 0 1078 411 387
1600 10/64 680 0 1078 411 376
1700 10/64 650 0 1078 411 360
1800 10/64 630 0 1078 411 348

LEFT FLOWING TO PIT ON 10/64" CHOKE.

02--18·-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total ?

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total ?

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 48 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208---12498 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: BREAK DOWN SUNNYSIDE ZONE

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 12 HRS. AT 6 AM, 10/64" CHOKE, FCP 600 PSIG, 332 MCFD, 0 BFPH. 411 BLWTR.

RU COMPUTALOG WL. RAN 3.750" GAUGE RING TO 12,332', RIH W/WEATHERFORD COMPOSITE BP. SET
DOWN @ 12,104'. POH W/BP. FLOWED WELL 2 HRS. RECOVERED TRACE OF SAND. RIH W/COMPOSITE BP,
SET @12,365'.

PERFORATED SUNNYSIDE FROM 12,208-09', 12,227-28', 12,234-35', 12,242-43', 12,268-69', 12,274-75', 12,291-
92', 12,299' & 12,330-31' W/3-l/8" HSC CASING GUN @3 SPF & 120°PHASING. SICP 0 PSIG. RDWL.

02-19-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling ? Completion Daily Total !
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Well Name: PETE S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 49 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST SUNNYSIDE ZONE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 1900 PSIG. RU SCHLUMBERGER. BROKE DOWN FORMATIONWl20 BBLS TREATED WATER@5.3 BPM
& 4660 PSIG. ISIP 4406 PSIG. FRAC DOWN CASING W/5000 GALS YF125ST PAD, 67,662 GALSYFl25ST &
YFl20ST W/232,100#20/40 SAND @ 1-6 PPG. (10 GPM SCALE INHIBITOR INYFl25ST). MTP 8445 PSIG. MTR
48.7 BPM. ATP 6193 PSIG. ATR 41.9 BPM. ISIP 6287 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED 15 HRS ON 10/64" TO 16/64" CHOKE. AT 6 AM, 16/64" CHOKE, FCP 800 PSIG, 35 BFPH. RECOVERED
655 BLW. 1104 BLWTR.

02-20-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 50 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED FOR 13 HRS ON 16/64 TO OPEN CHOKE. FCP 0 PSIG. 15-20 BFPH 1027 BLWR. 732 BLWTR. FLUID

HIGHY GAS CUT. VERY LITE TRACE OF SAND. SHUT WELL IN @ 18:00.

02-21-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 51 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN PRODUCTION TUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 500 PSIG. FLOWED ll HRS ON OPEN CHOKE. FCP 0 PSIG. 5-20 BFPH. 660 BLWTR. MIRUSU. SDFN.

02-22-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling $1 Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total $1

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 52 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SHUT DOWN FOR WEEKEND

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 600 PSIG. BLEW WELL DOWN. RIH W/BIT, PUMP OFF SUB, & 2-3/8", 4.7#, N-80 TUBING. TAGGEDFILL
@l1,901'. SDFW.

02-24-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling ? Completion ' Well Total $

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 53 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208--12498 PKR Depth : 0.0
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 2500 PSIG. BLEW WELL DOWN. RIH. WASHED SAND FROM 12026' TO 12365'. DRILLED OUT
WEATHERFORD COMPOSITE BP. RIH. WASHED SAND FROM 12383' TO 12815'. LANDED TUBING @1253T
KB. ND BOPE. NU TREE. DROPPED BALL. PUMPED OFF BIT & SUB.

TUBING DETAIL: LENGTH

PUMP OFF SUB 1.54'

l JT. 2-3/8" 4.7# N80 EUE TUBING 32.48'

XN NIPPLE 1.25'

388 JTS. 2-3/8" 4.7# N80 TUBING 12489.98'

BELOW KB 12.00'

TUBING LANDED AT 12537.25'

FLOW TESTED AS FOLLOWS:

TIME CHOKE FTP CP BFPH BLWR BLWTR GAS

18:00 12/64 600 700 0 3498 771

19:00 12/64 1000 600 35 3533 736

20:00 12/64 1000 1000 12 3545 724

21:00 12/64 1000 1000 10 3555 714 804

22:00 12/64 700 1400 10 3565 704 563

23:00 12/64 1100 1250 10 3575 694 884

24:00 12/64 1500 1300 10 3585 684 1,206

01:00 12/64 1450 1400 10 3595 674 1,166

02:00 12/64 1400 1500 10 3605 664 1,126

03:00 12/64 1400 1550 5 3610 659 1,126

04:00 12/64 1350 1500 3 3613 656 1,085

05:00 12/64 1350 1650 2 3615 654 1,085

02-25-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling i Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs; Drilling 5 Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 54 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW TESTED AS FOLLOWS:

TIME CHOKE FTP CP BFPH BLWR BLWTR GAS

06:00 12/64 1350 1700 5 3620 649 1,080

07:00 12/64 1300 1700 5 3625 644 1,045

08:00 12/64 1250 1850 5 3630 639 1,005

09:00 12/64 1250 1900 5 3635 634 1,005

10:00 12/64 1200 1950 5 3640 629 965

11:00 12/64 1200 2000 10 3650 619 965
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- Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

12:00 12/64 1200 2100 10 3660 609 965
13:00 12/64 1150 2100 10 3670 599 925
14:00 12/64 1150 2150 10 3680 589 925

15:00 12/64 1000 2150 15 3695 574 804
16:00 12/64 1200 2250 10 3705 564 965
17:00 16/64 1000 2200 10 3715 554 1,470

18:00 16/64 900 2200 10 3725 544 1 ,323

19:00 16/64 1000 2100 15 3740 529 1,470

20:00 16/64 1000 1950 10 3750 519 1,470

2l:00 16/64 850 1900 5 3755 514 1,250

22:00 16/64 800 1850 5 3760 509 1,176

23:00 16/64 800 1700 5 3765 504 1,176

24:00 16/64 800 1650 3 3768 501 1,176

01:00 16/64 800 1750 3 3771 498 1,176

02:00 16/64 800 1700 3 3774 495 1,176

03:00 16/64 750 1650 2 3776 493 1,103

04:00 16/64 700 1650 2 3778 491 1,029

05:00 16/64 700 1600 2 3780 489 1,029

02-26-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling ' Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 55 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED AS FOLLOWING CHART.

TIME CHOKE FTP CP BFPH BLWR BLWTR GAS

06:00 16/64 700 1700 2 3782 487 1,029

07:00 16/64 650 1700 2 3784 485 956

08:00 16/64 700 1700 2 3786 483 1,029

09:00 16/64 700 1550 2 3788 481 1,029

10:00 16/64 650 1550 l 3789 480 956
11:00 16/64 650 1550 1 3790 479 956

12:00 16/64 650 1550 1 3791 478 956
13:00 16/64 650 1550 1 3792 477 956
14:00 16/64 650 1550 1 3793 476 956

15:00 16/64 600 1500 2 3795 474 882

16:00 16/64 625 1500 2 3797 472 919

17:00 16/64 600 1500 2 3799 470 882

18:00 16/64 600 1500 2 3801 468 882

19:00 16/64 600 1500 2 3803 466 882

20:00 16/64 600 1500 2 3805 464 882
21:00 16/64 600 1500 1 3806 463 882
22:00 16/64 600 1500 1 3807 462 882

Page



Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

23:00 16/64 250 1600 0 3807 462 294

24:00 OPEN 0 2000 0 3807 462 0

01:00 OPEN 0 2050 0 3807 462 0

02:00 OPEN 0 2250 0 3807 462 0

03:00 SHUT 0 2400 0 3807 462 0

04:00 SHUT 0 2600 0 3807 462 0

05:00 SHUT 0 2800 0 3807 462 0

02-27-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 56 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WELL SHUT IN

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SHUT WELL IN @07:00.

TIME CHOKE TP CP

06:00 CLOSED 0 2900

07:00 CLOSED 0 3000

02-28-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 57 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 0 PSIG. CP 5700 PSIG. RU HOT OILER. PUMPED 45 BBLS WATER DOWN TUBING. PRESSURE
INCREASED TO 1000 PSIG BEFORE TUBING OBSTRUCTION CAME FREE. PUMPED ADDITIONAL 5 BW.
FLOW TESTED AS FOLLOWS:

TIME CHOKE FTP CP BFPH ACC. BBLS MCFD REMARKS

10:00 24/64 900 2750 3,060

l l:00 24/64 1100 1900 3,740 INSTALL 16/64

12:00 16/64 900 1900 1,323

13:00 16/64 1100 1900 1,617

14:00 16/64 1300 2100 CHOKE FREEZING

15:00 16/64 1500 2200 CHOKE FREEZING

16:00 16/64 1100 2400 1,617

17:00 16/64 1100 2250 2 2 1,617

18:00 16/64 1200 2000 2 4 CHOKE PLUGGING

19:00 16/64 1100 2000 2 6 1,617

20:00 16/64 1000 2000 20 26 1,470

21:00 16/64 1000 1900 20 46 1,470
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

22:00 16/64 850 1800 20 66 1,250

23:00 16/64 800 1700 15 81 1,176

24:00 16/64 800 1700 15 96 1,176

01:00 l6/64 900 1800 15 111 1,323

02:00 16/64 900 2050 10 121 1,323

03:00 16/64 850 2050 10 131 1,323

04:00 16/64 800 2400 10 141 1,176

05:00 16/64 750 2300 5 146 1,103

NOTE: FROM 17:00 TO 05:00 CHOKE PLUGGED INTERMITTENTLY W/PIECES OF COMPOSITE BP.
02-29-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling & Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 58 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW TESTED AS FOLLOWS:

TIME CHOKE FTP CP BFPH ACC GAS REMARKS

06:00 16/64 1350 2000 5 151 CHOKE PLUGGED

07:00 16/64 900 2000 5 156 1,323

08:00 16/64 700 1500 10 166 1,029

09:00 16/64 800 1500 10 176 1,176

10:00 16/64 750 1600 10 186 1,103

l l:00 16/64 700 1800 8 194 1,029

12:00 16/64 800 1800 8 202 1,176

13:00 16/64 950 1600 10 212 1,397

14:00 16/64 750 1600 8 220 1,103

15:00 16/64 700 1600 5 225 1,029

16:00 16/64 700 1600 5 230 1,029

17:00 16/64 700 1600 5 235 1,029

18:00 16/64 700 1600 5 240 1,029

19:00 16/64 700 1600 5 245 1,029

20:00 16/64 700 1600 5 250 1,029

21:00 16/64 700 1600 3 253 1,029

22:00 16/64 700 1600 3 256 1,029

23:00 16/64 700 1600 3 259 1,029
24:00 16/64 800 1600 3 262 1,176

Ol:00 16/64 500 1700 3 265 735

02:00 16/64 850 1600 3 268 1,250

0:300 16/64 700 1400 3 271 1,029

04:00 16/64 600 1400 3 274 882
05:00 16/64 550 1400 2 276 809
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- Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

03-01-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 59 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW TESTED AS FOLLOWS:

TIME CHOKE FTP CP BFPH ACC GAS REMARKS

06:00 16/64 550 1400 5 281 809

07:00 16/64 750 1500 5 286 1,103

08:00 16/64 750 1700 5 291 1,103

09:00 16/64 1050 1600 5 296 CHOKE PLUGGED

10:00 16/64 750 1400 5 301 1,103

11:00 16/64 550 1400 5 306 809

12:00 16/64 550 1400 5 311 809
13:00 16/64 550 1350 5 316 809
14:00 16/64 550 1350 5 321 809

15:00 16/64 550 1350 5 326 809
16:00 16/64 550 1350 5 331 809

17:00 16/64 500 1350 5 336 735

18:00 16/64 500 1300 3 339 735

19:00 16/64 500 1300 3 342 735
20:00 16/64 500 1300 3 345 735
21:00 16/64 500 1300 3 348 735
22:00 16/64 500 1300 3 351 735
23:00 16/64 500 1300 1 352 735
24:00 16/64 500 1300 1 353 735
Ol:00 16/64 500 1300 1 354 735

02:00 16/64 500 1300 l 355 735
03:00 16/64 500 1300 1 356 735

04:00 16/64 500 1300 1 357 735

05:00 16/64 500 1300 1 358 735

03-02-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 60 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW TESTED AS FOLLOWS:

Page 3l

i



Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

TIME CHOKE FTP CP BFPH ACC MCFD REMARKS

06:00 16/64 500 1300 1 359 735
07:00 16/64 500 1300 1 360 735
08:00 16/64 500 1250 2 362 735
09:00 16/64 550 1250 3 365 809
10:00 16/64 600 1300 2 367 882
1I:00 16/64 650 1350 3 370 956
12:00 16/64 650 1350 3 373 956
13:00 16/64 650 1300 2 375 956
14:00 16/64 525 1300 2 377 772
15:00 16/64 500 1250 3 380 735
16:00 16/64 500 1200 2 382 735
17:00 16/64 500 1200 1 383 735
18:00 16/64 500 1200 1 384 735
19:00 16/64 500 1200 1 385 735
20:00 16/64 500 1200 1 386 735
21:00 16/64 500 1200 1 387 735
22:00 16/64 500 1200 1 388 735
23:00 16/64 500 1200 TRACE 388 735
24:00 16/64 500 1200 0 388 735
Ol:00 16/64 500 1200 0 388 735
02:00 16/64 500 1200 0 388 735
03:00 16/64 500 1200 0 388 735
04:00 16/64 500 1200 0 388 735
05:00 16/64 500 1200 0 388 735

03-03-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling ? Completion Daily Total I
Cum Costs: Drilling 5 Completion Well Total
MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 61 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: WELL SI

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW TEST 2 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FTP 500 PSIG. CP 1200 PSIG. 735 MCFD. O BFPH. SL

03-06-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion '

Well Total
MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 56 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FRAC BLACKHAWK

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 14:00 8.0 MIRU K&S WELL SERVICE. SITP 2700 PSIG. SICP 5000 PSIG. BLEW WELL DOWN. KILLED WELL WITHTREATEDWATER. ND TREE & NU 10M PSIG BOPE. POH. SDFN.

©-07-2004 Reported By SEARLE
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.
Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

DailyCosts: Drilling E Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 57 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PERF BLACKHAWK

Start End Hrs Activity Description
07:00 17:00 10.0 SICP 2000 PSIG. BLEW CASING DOWN TO 900 PSIG. PUMPED 30 BBLS TREATED WATERDOWN CASING.

SICP 1100 PSIG. RU CUTTERS WL. RIH W/10K COMPOSITE BP & SET DOWN @11,402'. BP STUCK. FLOWED
30 MIN ON 24/64" CHOKE. FCP 400 PSIG. WORKED WL WITH NO MOVEMENT. LOADED HOLE W/130 BBLS
TREATED WATER. CP 2800 PSIG. WORKED WL WITH NO MOVEMENT. SET BP. RDWL. BLEW WELL DOWN.
RIH W/3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUB. DRILLED OUT BP @11,402'. RIH TO 12,530'. POH TO 12,155'. SDFN.

03-08-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling i Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling ' Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 58 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: FRAC BLACKHAWK

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 16:30 10.5 SITP 600 PSIG. SICP 2900 PSIG. FLOWED 3 HRS. 12/64"-32/64" CHOKES. FTP 0 PSIG. CP 400 PSIG. KILLED

WELL WITH TREATEDWATER. POH.

RUWL. SET 10K COMPOSITE BP @12,082'. TESTED BP TO 5000 PSIG. PERFORATEDBLACKHAWK FLUVIAL
FROM @ 11,940'-42', I1,964'-65', 11,982'-83', 12,003'-04', 12,01l'-13', 12,037'-39' & 12,052'-53' W/3-1/8" HSC
PORTED CASING GUNS @3 SPF & 120° PHASING. RDWL. PUMPED 5 BBLS TREATEDWATER@ l.2 BPM &
5000 PSIG. ISIP 4800 PSIG.

FLOWED 30 MINS THROUGH OPEN CHOKE. RECOVERED 140 BLW. FLOWED 30 MIN THROUGH 32/64"
CHOKE. FCP 225 PSIG. 6-8 BFPH. RECOVERED 4 BLW. 46 BLWTR. SDFN.

03-09-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 59 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 900 PSIG. FLOWED 50 MINS. FCP 0 PSIG. NO FLUID. 4'-5' FLARE THROUGH2" LINE.

RU SCHLUMBERGER. LOADED HOLE W/160 BBLS SLICK WATER. FRAC BLACKHAWKFLUVIAL DOWN
CASING W/4953 GALS YF125ST PAD, 41,908 GALS YFl25ST & YF118ST & 163,721# 20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. 10
GAL/M SCALE INHIBITOR INYFl25ST STAGES. MTP 7957 PSIG. MTR 46.6 BPM. ATP 1097 PSIG. ATR 42.1
BPM. ISIP 5200 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED 18 HRS ON 10/64-12/64" CHOKES. AT 5 AM, 12/64" CHOKE, FCP 1300PSIG, 8-10 BFPH, TRACE OF
SAND. RECOVERED 1130 BLW. 415 BLWTR.

03-10-2004 Reported By SEARLE
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. Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

DailyCosts: Drilling I Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total $

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 60 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: DRILL OUT PLUG

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS ON 24/64" CHOKE. FCP 200 PSIG. 4-6 BFPH. RECOVERED 265 BLW. 150 BLWTR.

PRESSURE STABLE LAST 8 HRS.

03-11-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling -, Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress O Days 61 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FCP 200 PSIG. KILLED WELL W/60 BBLS TREATEDWATER. RIH Wl3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUB. CLEANED
OUT FROM 12,050' TO BP @12,082'. DRILLED OUT BP. RIH TO 12,700'. LANDED TUBING @ 12,53T KB. ND
BOPE. NU TREE. DROPPED BALL. PUMPED OFF BIT. RDMO SU.

FLOWED 15 HRS ON 16/64" CHOKE. FTP 850 PSIG. CP l100 PSIG. 2-3 BFPH. STEADY FLARE. RECOVERED
295 BLW. 170 BLWTR.

03-12-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling ' Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 62 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: SHUT IN

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 15:00 9.0 FLOWED 9 HRS ON 16/64" CHOKE. AT 3 PM, FTP 700 PSIG, CP 1300 PSIG, 2-3 BFPH. RECOVERED 36 BLW. 134

BLWTR. SI. WILL DROP FROM REPORT WHILE WO FACILITIES.

FINAL COMPLETION DATE: 3/11/04

06-17-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling a Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 63 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: INITIAL PRODUCTION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 OPENING PRESSURE: TP 4200 & CP 4200 PSIG. TURNED WELL TO QUESTAR SALES AT 4:00 PM, 6/16/04.

FLOWING 650 MCFD ON 10/64" POS CK.
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

06-18 -2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling & Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 64 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 679 MCFD, 4 BC & 152BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CHOKE, TP 3550 PSIG, CP 4450 PSIG.

06-21-2004 Reported By GEORGE MCBRIDE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 65 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 6/19/04 - FLOWED 766 MCF, 16 BC & 97 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, FTP 3350 & CP 4150 PSIG.

6/20/04 - FLOWED 760 MCF, 0 BC & 168 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, FTP 2800 & CP 3600 PSIG.

6/21/04 - FLOWED 698 MCF, 4 BC & 123 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, FTP 2550 & CP 3300 PSIG.

06-22-2004 Reported By GEORGE MCBRIDE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 66 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Descriptíon
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 656 MCF, 5 BC & l17 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, FTP 2400 & CP 3150 PSIG.

06·-23-2004 Reported By GEORGE MCBRIDE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 67 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 603 MCF, 0 BC & 142 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, FTP 2250 & CP 3000 PSIG.

06-24-2004 Reported By GEORGE MCBRIDE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion i Daily Total
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion 5 Well Total
MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 68 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 586 MCF, 4 BC & 98 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, FTP 2200 & CP 2950 PSIG.

-2004 Reported By GEORGE MCBRIDE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 69 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 570 MCF, 0 BC & 78 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, FTP 2150 & CP 2850 PSIG.

06-28-2004 Reported By GEORGE MCBRIDE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 70 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 6/26/04 - FLOWED 551 MCF, 5 BC & 86 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, FTP 2050 & CP 2700 PSIG.

6/27/04 - FLOWED 522 MCF, 3 BC & 87 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, FTP 2000 & CP 2650 PSIG.

6/28/04 - FLOWED 515 MCF, 2 BC & 58 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, FTP 2000 & CP 2625 PSIG. WILL UPSIZE
CHOKE TODAY.

06-29-2004 Reported By GEORGE MCBRIDE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total ,

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 71 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 499 MCF, 0 BC & 103 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, FTP 1975 & CP 2600 PSIG. LP 718 PSIG. CHANGED

CHOKE TO 12/64".

06-30-2004 Reported By GEORGE MCBRIDE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion ' Well Total
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 72 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf: 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 608 MCF, 5 BC & 130 BW IN 24 HRS ON 12/64" CK, FTP 1300 & CP 2050 PSIG. LP 705 PSIG.
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ST OF UTAH AMENDED REPORT FORM 8
DEPARTMENT ATURAL RESOURCES (highlightchanges)g i g - DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS ANDMINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UT-ST-ML-47068

WELL COMPLETIONOR RECOMPLETIONREPORT ANDLOG
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

1a. TYPE OF WELL: OIL GAS DRY OTHER 7. UNIT or CAAGREEMENT NAMEWELL WELL
PETE'S WASHUNIT

b. TYPEOF WORK: 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:NE
L

TRZ. EP- -TRY DREFSFVR.
OTHE PETE'S WASH32-2

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APINUMBER:
EOG RESOURCES, INC 4301332453

3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONENUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL,OR WILDCAT
P.O. BOX 250 errv BIG PINEY swa WY av 83113 (307) 276-3331 KENILWORTHIBLACKHAWK

4. LOCATION OF WELL(FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR,SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,
MERIDIAN:AT SURFACE: 2049 FNL - 195 FEL

EXP SWNIE 2 11S 16E
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVAL REPORTED BELOW: 2049 FNL - 19 FEL. ON-

12. COUNTY 13. STATEATTOTALDEPTH: 2049FNiL-196 FEL ÚlNTAH UTAH
14. DATE SPUDDED: 15. DATE T.D. REACHED: 16. DATE COMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, GL):

11/17/2003 2/1/2004 6/16/2004 ABANDONED READY TO PRODUCE 6541 KB
18. TOTAL DEPTH: MD gg 19. PLUG BACK T.D.: MD 1 Ogg 20. IF MULTIPLE COMPLETIONS HOW MANY? * 21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD

PLUG SET:
TVD - TVD TVD

22. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICAL LOGS RUN (Submit copyof each) 23.

CBL, TRIPLE DENSITYlGR, MICROLOGIGR, DIPOLE SONIC/GR WASWELLCORED7 NO YES (Submitanalysis)

& ARRAY INDUCTION WILINEARCORRELATION WASDSTRUN? NO YES (Submitreport)

DIRECTIONAL SURVEY7 NO YES (Submit copy)
24. CASIENSIZENDLINER RECORAD(Report all stdngs set in well)

TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) STAGEDCEMHENTER CNEMEONF
S

KES VOLSUL
BL) CEMENT TOP ** AMOUNT PULLED

17.5 13. 325 H-80 48.0 0 318 $W
12.250 9. 625 J-55 40.0 0 3,997 530
7.875 4. 600 P-110 11.6 0 13,090 1095

25. TUBINGRECORD

SIZE DEPTHSET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

2.375 12.537
26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD

FORMATION NAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM (TVD) INTERVAL (Top/Bot - MD) SIZE NO.HOLES PERFORATION STATUS

(A) BLACKHAWK 11,940 12,495 12,423 12,498 3 open Squeezed

(B) 12,208 12,331 3 Open Squeezed

(C) 11,940 12,053 3 open Sgueezed

(D) Open Squeezed

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNT AND TYPE OF MATERIAL

12,423 TO 12,498 1267 BBLS GELLED WATER &168,497 #20/40 SAND
12,208 TO 12,331 1730 BBLSGELLED WATER&232,100 #20/40 SAND
11,940 TO 12,053 1116 BBLSGELLED WATER& 163,721 #20/40 SAND

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELLSTATUS:

ELECTRICAL/MECHANICALLOGS GEOLOGICREPORT DSTREPORT ÑE ENEE RODUCINGSUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGING AND CEMENT VERIFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER:

(5/2000) (CONTINUEDON BACK) DIV.OFOIL,GAS&



I

31. INITIALPRODUCTION MERVAL A (As shown in item #26)
DATEFIRSTPRODUCED: TESTDATE: HOURSTESTED: TESTPRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:6/16/2004 6/26/2004 24 RATES: -* 5 551 86 FLOWSCHOKESIZE: TBG.PRESS. CSG. PRESS. APIGRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OILRATIO 24 HRPRODUCTIONOIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATÙS:10/64 2,020 2,700 RATES: -' 5 551 86

INTERVAL B (As shown in item #26)
DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TESTDATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD, METHOD:RATES: -+

CHOKE SlZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. APIGRAVITY BTU - GAS GASIOIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVAL STATUS:RATES: ->

INTERVAL C (As shown in item #26)
DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:RATES: ->

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVAL STATUS:RATES: ->

INTERVALD (As shown in item #26)
DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:RATES: ->

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTIONOIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVAL STATUS:RATES:
32. DISPOSITIONOF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

SOLD
33. SUMMARY OF POROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION (Log) MARKERS:
Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof:Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth intervaltested, cushion used, time toolopen, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Formation Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name
(Measu

edp
Depth)

BLACKHAWK 11,940 12,498 WASATCH 4.890
BASEOILSHALE 2.652
WASATCH 4.882
NORTHHORN 7,250
LOWER NORTHHORN 8,305
MESAVERDE 9,412
MIDDLE PRICE RIVER 10,466
LOWER PRICE RIVER 11,168
SEGO 11,601

35. ADDITIONAL REMARK: (Include plugg ng procedure)

SEE ATTACHED SHEET

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached Information is complete and correct as determined from all available records.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) ALFREDASCHULZ
TITLE SR. REGULATORY ASSISTANT

SIGNATUR
DATE 7/2/2004

his report must ubmitted within30 days of
e completing or plugging a new well • reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well• drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore • significantly deepening an existing wellbore below the previous bottom-hole depthe recompleting to a different producing formation • drilling hydrocarbon exploratoryholes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

ITEM 20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from twoor more formations.
*lTEM24: Cement Top -Show how reported top(s)of cement were determined (circulated (CIR),calculated (CAL), cement bond log (CBL),temperaturesurvey (TS)).end to: IJtah Division of Oil,Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-53401594 West NorthTemple, Suite 1210

Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940Salt Lake City,Utah 84114-5801



O

ADDITIONAL REMARKS:

FORMATION (Log) MARKERS CON'T: CASTLEGATE_UNCON BA 11,923, CASTLEGATE 11,694.

TURNED TO SALES THROUGH QUESTAR METER #688. VOLUME WILL BE ALLOCATED TOEOG MONTHLY. Two 400 BBL Tanks #80349V & 80350V are on location.

Perforated Kenilworth from 12,423-24', 12,435-37', 12,470-71', 12,475-76', 12,482-83', 12,490-91' &12,497-98' w 3/SPF.
Perforated Sunnyside from 12,208-09', 12,227-28', 12,234-35', 12,242-43', 12,268-69', 12,274-75',12,291-92', 12,298-99' & 12,330-31' w 3/SPF.
Perforated Blackhawk Fluvial from 11,940-42', 11,964-65', 11,982-83', 12,003-04', 12,011-13', 12,037-
39' & 12,052-53' w 3/SPF.



STA OF UTAH FORM 9
' DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

Ûjg DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING S. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
UT-ST-ML-47068

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantlydeepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° PETE'S WASH UNITdrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMlT TO ÖRILL form forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER PETE'S WASH 32-2

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC 4301332453
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

P.O. BOX 250 BIG PINEY , 47, WY 83113 (307) 276-3331 WILDCAT
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 2049 FNL - 1956 FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SWNE 2 11S 16E STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EOG Resources, Inc. requests authorization for disposal of produced water from the referenced well to the following location.

Brennan Disposal Inc.
SEC 19, T6S, R21E
Uintah County, Utah

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FORRECORDONLY

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) ALFREDA SCHULZ TITLE SR. REGULATORY ASSISTANT

SIGNATURE DATE 7/2/2004

(This space for State use only) AECEIVça
JULU6 20

UNOFOILGASe '
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) ' L /Sij



ST OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
UT-ST-ML 47068

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells,significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° PETE'S WASHdrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER PETE'S WASH 32-2

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC 4301332453
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

P.O. BOX 250 BIG PINEY WY ,,83113 (307) 276-3331 WILDCAT
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 2049 FNL - 1959 FyfL COUNTY: DUCHESNE

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: S NE 2 11S 16E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME} WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER: DRILLING
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION OPERATIONS

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see the attached well chronology report for drilling operations from 11/17/2003 to 6/30/2004.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Alfreda Schulz

SIGNATURE

TEELEE Sr.0Re00ulatoryAssistant
RECEWED

,
,)

JUL09 peg
(This space for State use only) UNOFOIL,GAS&MINING

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT

Report Generated On: 06-30-2004

Well Name PETE'S WASH 32-02 Well Type EXPG Division DENVER
Field KENILWORTH API # 43-013-32453 Well Class ISA

County, State DUCHESNE, UT Spud Date 12-30-2003 Class Date 06-16-2004

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 13,100/ 13,100 Property # 053287
Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 0/ 0

KB / GL Elev 6,541/ 6,527

Location Section 2, T11S, R16E, SWNE, 2049 FNL & 1959 FEL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOGRESOURCES,TNC WI% 50,0 NRI% 41.75

AFE No 302456 AFE Total DHC / CWC

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #9 Start Date 07-11-2003 Release Date
Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #9 Start Date 07-14-2003 Release Date
Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #9 Start Date 12-02-2003 Release Date

DRILLING

07-11-2003 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0
Cum Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Well Total $0
MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION DATA

2049' FNL & 1959' FEL (SW/NE)

SECTION2,TllS,Rl6E

DUCHESNE COUNTY,UTAH

39.887606 LAT, 110.08845 LONG

TD: 13,100' BLACKHAWK FORMATION
TRUE RIG #9

WC/GAS

KENILWORTH PROSPECT

LEASE: UT ST ML-47068

ELEVATION: 6528' NAT GL, 6527' PREP GL, 6541' KB (14')

EOG BPO WI: 50%, NRI 41.75%

EOG APO WI: 25%, NRI



Well Name: PETF'S WASH 3 02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

12-02-2003 Reported By EDDIE TROTTER

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 303 TVD 303 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU CRAIG'S AIR RIG. SPUDDED 17-1/2" SURFACE HOLE AT 7:00 AM, 11/17/03.

DRILLED 17-1/2" HOLE TO 315' GL. RUN 7 JTS (303.05' GL) OF 13-3/8", 48.0#/FT, H-40, ST&C CASING &
LANDED AT 317.55'KB. RU DOWELL. PRESSURE TESTED LINES & CEMENT VALVE TO 1000 PSIG. MIXED &
PUMPED 20 BBLS GELLED WATER & 10 BBLS WATER FLUSH AHEAD OF CEMENT. MIXED & PUMPED 267
SX CLASS G CEMENT W/1% CACL-2 & 1/4#/SX CELLOFLAKES. MIXED CEMENT AT 15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF
1.15 CF/SX (54.4 BBLS). DISPLACED CEMENT W/40 BBLS WATER & SHUT-IN CASING VALVE. HAD 5 BBLS
CEMENT RETURNS TO SURFACE. RD DOWELL. PREPARED LOCATION FOR ROTARY RIG. WORT. WILL
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DING WELL.

12-30-2003 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD - 420 TVD 420 Progress 200 Days 1 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 16:00 10.0 NIPPLE UP DIVERTER, SPACER SPOOL, ROTATINGHEAD, VALVES,& BOOIE LINE TO FLARE PIT.

16:00 19:00 3.0 HOOKED UP FLOW LINE, ADDED 1-1/2' TO FLOW LINE, WELDER BUILT SPOOL TO MAKE IT FIT.

19:00 00:00 5.0 PU BIT, BS, MM, SS, FOUR 8" DC, XO, FIVE 6-1/2" DC.
00:00 04:00 4.0 DRILLED CEMENT 275' TO 320', DRILLED VERY ROUGH WITH A LOT OF TORQUE. FUNCTION DIVERTER &

HYDRAULICED VALVE.

04:00 06:00 2.0 DRILLED FORMATION 320' TO 420', WT 15/20, RPM 60/65, PSI 1320, SPM 117 BOTH, GAL 685, FPR 100.

CALLED CAROL DANIELS AT STATE OF UTAH DEPT OF OIL & GAS DIVISION AT 1800 HRS, 12/29/03, GOT
ANSWERING MACHINE, LEFT MESSAGE.

SAFTEY MEETINGS: BE AWARE OF TOTAL SUROUNDINGS & NIPPLING UP BOP STACK
FUNCTION DEVERTER & HYD VALVE, OK.

RIG ON DAYWORK @06:00, 12/29/03.

SPUDDED 12-l/4" HOLE AT 04:00, 12/30/03.

12-31-2003 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total i

MD 990 TVD 990 Progress 570 Days 2 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 3 02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

O O

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 DRLG 420' TO 445' {25},WT 15/20, RPM 60/65, PSI 1350, SPM 111 BOTH PUMPS, GPM 684, FPH 25'.
07:00 07:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @385°, 5°, RAN TWO SURVEY'S, BOTH 5 DEGREES.
07:30 11:30 4.0 DRLG 445' TO 563' {ll8 '},WT 10,000, RPM 90/89, PSI 1350, SPM l16/103, GPM 684, FPH 29.50'.

I1:30 12:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @475', 4°, {90'}.
12:00 12:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE. CK CROWN A MATIC.
12:30 14:30 2.0 DRLG 563' TO 685' {122'}, WT 12,000, RPM 90/89, PSI 1400, SPM 116/103, GPM 684, FPH 61'.

14:30 15:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @565', 4°, {90'}.
15:00 19:00 4.0 DRLG 685' TO 802' {117'}, WT 10,000, RPM 90/89, PSI 1450, SPM 116/103, GPM 684, FPH 29.25'.

19:00 19:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @710', 4°, {145'}.

19:30 24:00 4.5 DRLG 802' TO 896' {94'}, WT 8,000,RPM 90/89, PSI 1350/1500, SPM 116/103, GPM 610, FPH 20.88'.

24:00 00:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @796', 3.1/4° {86'}.

00:30 05:30 5.0 DRLG 896' TO 990' {94'}, WT 8/10', RPM 65/95, PSI 1650/1700, SPM 65/110, GPM 729, FPH 18.80'.

05:30 06:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @890', 23/4°.

SAFTEY MEETINGS ON RUNNING WIRELINE SURVEY

ICY CONDITIONS

RELAYING HAND SIGNALS

01-01-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling S' Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 1,870 TVD 1,870 Progress 880 Days 3 MW 8.4 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:30 3.5 DRLG 990' TO 1082' {92'}, WT 8/10,RPM 65/95, PSI 1500/1600, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 26.28'.

09:30 10:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @982 2 DEGREE.

10:00 10:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CHECK CROWN A MATIC.

10:30 13:00 2.5 DRLG 1082' TO 1176' {94'}, WT 12/15, RPM 65/95, PSI 1500/1700, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 37.6'.

13:00 13:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @1076' 1.75 DEGREE.

13:30 17:30 4.0 DRLG 1082' TO 1301, {219'}, WT 15/20, RPM 65/95, PSI 1500/1650, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 54.75'.
17:30 18:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @1201' l.75 DEGREE.

18:00 20:00 2.0 DRLG 1301' TO 1426' {125} WT 25, RPM 65/95, PSI 1500/1650, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 62.5}.
20:00 20:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @1326', 1.5 DEG.

20:30 22:30 2.0 DRLG 1426'TO 1581' {l55'} WT 25 RPM 65/95, PSI 1500/1650, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 77.50'.
22:30 23:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @1481'2-3/4 DEGREE.
23:00 00:00 1.0 DRLG 1581' TO 1675' {94'}, WT 20, RPM 65/120, PSI 1500/1650, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 94'.
00:00 00:30 0.5 SURVEY @1575'2 DEGREE.

00:30 01:30 1.0 DRLG 1675' TO 1706' {31'}, WT 20/25, RPM 65/95, PSI 1500/1650, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 31'.
01:30 02:00 0.5 RIG REPAIR, WORK ON PUMP.

02:00 04:00 2.0 DRLG 1706 TO 1800' {94'} WT 20/25, RPM 65/95, PSI 1500/1650, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 47'.
04:00 04:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @1700'2-l/4 DEGREE.
04:30 06:00 1.5 DRLG 1800' TO 1870' {70},WT 20/25, RPM 65/120, PSI 1500/1650/, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 46.66.
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Well Name: PETK'S WASH 32 02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

SAFETY MEETING ON HORSE PLAY & PICKING PIPE UP OUT OF PIPE TUBS.
01-02-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling '" Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 2,670 TVD 2,670 Progress 800 Days 4 MW 8.4 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 08:00 2.0 DRLG 1870' TO 1925' {55}, WT 20/26, RPM 65/95, PSI 1500/1650, SPM 105/120, GPM 729 FPH 27.50.
08:00 08:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @1820'2-1/4 DEGREE.
08:30 13:00 4.5 DRLG 1925' TO 2081, {156'}, WT 20/25, RPM 65/95, PSI 1500/1650, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 34.66'.
13:00 13:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @ 1981'2 DEGREE.

13:30 14:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC, FUNCTION DIVERTER & SCR VALVE, KELLY & FLOOR VALVES.
14:00 17:00 3.0 DRLG 2081' TO 2205' {124'} WT 20/25, RPM 65/95, PSI 1550/1700, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 41.33.
17:00 17:30 0.5 CHANGE OUT LUBICATOR & DRUM WHEEL ON AUTO DRILLER.
17:30 19:30 2.0 DRLG 2205' TO 2268' {63'}, WT 25/30, RPM 65/95, PSI 1550/1700, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 31.50.
19:30 20:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @2164' 2 DEGREE.

20:00 00:30 4.5 DRLG 2268' TO 2454' {186} WT 30/35, RPM 65/95, PSI 1600/1730, SPM 106/120, GPM 729, FPH 41.33'.

00:30 01:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @2354'2 DEGREE.
01:00 03:00 2.0 DRLG 2454' TO 2579' {125'} WT 35/40, RPM 65/95, PSI 1650/1770, SPM 106/120, GPM 729, FPM 62.50'.
03:00 03:30 0.5 CHANGE SWAB ON #1 PUMP.
03:30 06:00 2.5 DRLG 2579' TO 2670' {91'} WT 40,000#, RPM 65/95, PSI 1650/1770, SPM 106/120,GPM 729, FPH 36.40'.

SAFETY MEETING ON TAG OUT & LOCK OUT, HOUSE CLEANING, BOILER, STEAM LINES, STEAM
HEATERS.

GREEN RIVER FORMATION, BG GAS 50/100, CONN GAS 100/300, DTGAS 200/500
01-03-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 3,535 TVD 3,535 Progress 865 Days 5 MW 8.4 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 08:30 2.5 DRLG 2670' TO 2766'{96'} WT 40, RPM 63/94, PSI 1650/1770, SPM 106/120,GPM 728, FPH 38.4'.
08:30 09:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @2666'2 DEGREE.

09:00 12:30 3,5 DRLG 2766' TO 2950' {l84'} WT 40, RPM 63/94, PSI 1650/1780, SPM 106/120, GPM 728, FPH 52.57'.

12:30 13:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC, KELLY & FLOOR VALVE.

13:00 21:00 8.0 DRLG 2950' TO 3262' {312}WT 40, RPM 65/95, PSI 1670/1820, SPM 105/120, GPM 729, FPH 39',
21:00 21:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @3162' 1/2 DEGREE.
21:30 06:00 8.5 DRLG 3262' TO 3535 {273'} WT 40 RPM, 63/95, PSI 1650/1850, SPM 102/115, GPM 7035 FPH 32.1l'.

FORMATION GREEN RIVER, BG GAS 50-100, CONN GAS 100-300, DT GAS 200-500.
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287' O O

SAFETY MEETING ON WORKING ON PUMPS, GETTING PLENTY OF REST BEFORE COMING TO WORK,
GETTIN TO AND FROM WORK SAFELY. ROADS VERY SLIPPERY.

01-04-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling ,
- Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 3,801 TVD 3,801 Progress 266 Days 6 MW 8.4 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TRIP FOR BIT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:30 2.5 DRLG 3535' TO 3603' {71'} WT 40, RPM 63/95, PSI 1650/1850, SPM 102/115, GPM 735, FPR 28.40'.

08:30 09:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC, FUNCTION DIVERTER & SCR VALVE, KELLY & FLOOR VALVES.

09:00 14:00 5.0 DRLG 3603' TO 3690' {87}WT 40, RPM 63/95, PSI 1650/1850, SPM 103/115, GPM 735, FPH 17.40.
14:00 19:30 5.5 DROP SURVEY, TRIP OUT & IN. HOLE IN GOOD CONDITION, BIT 1/4" OUT OF GAUGE.

19:30 20:00 0.5 WASH & REAM 3610' TO 3690' {80'}, 40 ' OF HOLE OUT OF GAUGE.

20:00 04:30 8.5 DRLG 3690' TO 3801' {111'} WR 10/40 RPM 63/95, PSI 1600/1800, SPM 103/120, GPM 735 FPH 13.03'.

04:30 06:00 1.5 TRIP OUT OF HOLE, BIT QUIT DRILLING.

FORMATION GREEN RIVER, BG GAS 50-100, CONN GAS 100-300, DT GAS 200/300, TRIP GAS 2328.

SAFETY MEETINGS ON BREAKING IN NEW HANDS, TRIPPING.

BIT DRILLED 80'REAL GOOD, HAD SOME TORQUE, SLOWED DOWN TO 5.6' FPH. PULLED IT, BEARING'S
GONE ON NOSE CONE, NOSE CONE GONE, LOOKS LIKE IT WENT INTO WALL AFTER CONNECTION, NO
MORE TORQUE.

01-05-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total 5

Cum Costs: Drilling . Completion Well Total

MD 4,000 TVD 4,000 Progress 199 Days 7 MW 8.4 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TRIP OUT FOR LOGS..

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:30 0.5 FINISH TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT #3.

06:30 07:30 1.0 LAY DOWN MUD MOTOR, CHANGE BITS.

07:30 11:30 4.0 TRIP IN HOLE, HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE.

11:30 13:30 2.0 WASH & REAM 3701' TO 3801' {100'}. WORK PAST JUNK FROM BIT #2.

13:30 23:30 10.0 DRLG 3801' TO 4000' {199}WT 5/50, RPM 60, PSI 1350, SPM 100/105, GPM 665, FPH 19.9'.

23:30 00:30 1.0 CIRC & PUMP HIGH GEL/LCM SWEEP.

00:30 01:00 0.5 SHORT TRIP 5 STANDS,CHAIN OUT, HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE.

01:00 02:30 1.5 CIRC & PUMP HIGH GEL/LCM SWEEP. SPOT HIGH VIS PILL ON BOTTOM, WAIT ON SCHLUMBERGER CALL.
TRUCK BROKE DOWN ON WAYTO RIG, WENT BACK TO YARD & CHANGED TRUCKS.

02:30 03:00 0.5 DROP SURVEY.

03:00 06:00 3.0 TRIP FOR LOGS. CHAINED OUT 1ST 5 STANDS. SLM, HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE.

FORMATION GREEN RIVER. BG 50-11, CONN GAS 100-300, TG 2328U, DTG 200-300U.
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- Well Name: PETE'S WASH32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287O O

SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING W/NEW HANDS, CHANGE OUT TONG & SLIP DIES.

PUSH NOSE CONE OFF TO SIDE, HAD NO MORE TROUBLE WITH IT, CHAINED OUT 5 STANDS SO NOT TO
KNOCK IT LOOSE, HOPE FOR THE BEST.

SCHLUMBERGER TRUCK LOST IT'S LIGHTS ON WAYOUT TO LOCATION, RETURNED TO SHOP & CHANGED
TRUCKS.

01-06-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling a Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 4,000 TVD 4,000 Progress 0 Days 8 MW 8.4 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: RIG UP TO CIRC

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 12:00 6.0 RIG UP LOGGERS & RUN LOGS W/SCHLUMBERGER. RUN GR TO SURFACE, RESISTIVITY, POROSITY,
DIPOLE SONIC & MICROLOG TO BOTTOM OF SURFACE AT 318'. HOLE PRETTY MUCH IN GAUGE,
LOGGER'S TD AT 3996'.

12:00 13:00 1.0 RIG DOWN LOGGERS.

13:00 13:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC, GREASE CROWN & BLOCKS.
13:30 14:00 0.5 PICK UP BHA.

14:00 17:00 3.0 TRIP IN HOLE TO CONDITION FOR CASING, HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE.

17:00 17:30 0.5 WASH & REAM l15' TO BOTTOM, 5'FILL.
17:30 18:30 1.0 CIRC & CONDITION HOLE FOR LOGS, PUMPED HIGH GEL/LCM SWEEP, SPOTTED GEL SWEEP ON BOTTOM.
18:30 19:00 0.5 PUMPED PILL & CHAINED OUT 5 STANDS PIPE.

19:00 21:30 2.5 TRIP OUT TO 8" DC, HOLE OK.
21:30 22:30 1.0 LAY DOWN 4 - 8" DC'S, BIT SUB & BIT. RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE.
22:30 06:00 7.5 RIG UP CASERS & RUN 87 JTS OF 9-5/8, 40#, J-55, LT&C CASING, SHOE LANDED AT 3997', INSERT FLOAT AT

3943' KB. INSTALLED ROTATINGHEAD.

TORQUED CASING SHOE TO 5650 FT-LBS, INSTALLED INSERT FLOAT COLLAR, TORQUE 9-5/8" CASING TO
4520 FT-LBS.

HELD SAFETY MEETINGS ON LEAKS & SPILLS, RIGGlNG UP CASERS. HAD MEETING WITH CASING CREW
ON SAFE WAYTO RUN CASING. EVERYONE WASPRESENT.

FORMATION GREEN, BG GAS.

ROADS VERY SLIPPERY, WATERTRUCKS WERE CHAINED UP STILL STUCK WHILE GOING UP HILL,
CALLED CRAIG'S ROUSTABOUTTO COME AND BLADE ICE OFF ROAD.

01-07-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling i Completion Well Total

MD 4,000 TVD 4,000 Progress 0 Days 9 MW 8.4 Visc 24.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: NIPPLE UP BOP STACK

Start End Hrs Activity Description
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

Ô O

06:00 08:30 2.5 TRY TO CIRC CASlNG, WOULDN"T CIRC,/WORK CASING & TRY TO UNPLUG, PUMP PRESSURE UP TO 1600
PSI, CASING JUMPED UP & STARTED CIRC. LOST 15,000#WT ON WT INDICATOR.

08:30 12:00 3.5 CIRC & WAIT ON WIRELINE TO RUN COLLAR LOCATER, TO SEE IF CASING PARTED,

12:00 14:00 2.0 RIG UP WELLSERV INTERVENTION SERVICES & RUN CCL, CASING HAD NOT PARTED.

14:00 14:30 0.5 RIG DOWN WELLLSERV & FRANK'S WESTATES CASERS, LOAD OUT SAME.

14:30 16:00 1.5 RIG UP SCHLUMBERGER CEMENTERS, PRESSURE TEST LINES,TO3,000#, HELD SAFTEY MEETING ON
CEMENTING.

16:00 18:00 2.0 CEMENT 9 5/8" INTERMEDIATE CASING WITH 315 SKs HILIFT G +ADDS LEAD {YIELD=3.91} H20=24.46
GAL/SK @11PPG, 215 SKsl0-2 RFC +ADDS TAIL{YIELD=1.61} H20 8.0 GAL/SK @14.1 PPG,DISP W/ FRESH
WATER.

18:00 22:00 4.0 WASH TOP 30' CASING & DEVERTER OUT WITH FRESH WATER,NIPPLE DOWN DEVERTER STACK.

22:00 24:00 2.0 SET C-22 CASING SLIPS, CUT OFF 9 5/8 CASING {20.55'}. SET WITH 100,000#.

24:00 01:00 1.0 FINISH NIPPLE DOWN DERVERTER STACK& SET OUT.

01:00 02:30 1.5 NIPPLE UP C-22-EG CASING SPOOL {B SECTION} TEST TO 1500 PSI FOR 10 MINUTES, OK.

02:30 06:00 3.5 PICK UP l1"/5,000 BOP STACK, ANNULAR, & ROTATINGHEAD, NIPPLE UP STACK.

06:00

SAFTEY MEETING'S WITH CASER'S ON RUNNING CASING, WORKINGAROUND SCHLUMBERGER &
THERE HIGH PRESSURE LINES, MEETING W/ SCHLUMBERGER ON CEMENTING.

CASING PLUGGED WHEN ON BOTTOM, UNPLUGGED WITH 1600 PSI, APPEARED TO HAVE PARTED AS LOST
15,00# ON WT INDICATOR. CK CASING WITH COLLAR LOCATOR, CASING OK/

18 DEGREE THIS MORNING, SNOWING, ROADS SLIPPERY.

01-08-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling ' Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion ~ Well Total

MD 4,173 TVD 4,173 Progress 173 Days 10 MW 8.4 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD.

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 11:00 5.0 NIPPLE UP BOP STACK,ANNULAR, ROTATINGHEAD, CHOKE MANIFOLD & KILL LINES.

11:00 19:00 8.0 TEST BOP STACK,TEST PIPE RAMS, BLIND RAMS, CHOKE LINE, KILL LINES, UPPER KELLY,LOWER KELLY,
SAFETY VALVES& CHOKE MANIFOLD TO 5,000# FOR 10 MINUTES, ANNULAR 2500 FOR 10MINUTES,
CASING 1500# FOR 30 MINUTES, ACCUMULATORPRESSURE 3,000#, MANIFOLD 1500#, ANNULAR PSI 1,000#.

19:00 20:00 1.0 INSTALL WEAR RING & PICK UP BHA.

20:00 22:30 2.5 TRIP IN HOLE W/NEW BIT.

22:30 23:30 1.0 CUT & SLIP 75' DRLG LINE.

23:30 00:30 1.0 DLG CEMENT INSERT FLOAT & SHOE. TAGGED CEMENT @3954'.

00:30 01:00 0.5 DRLG 4000' TO 4010' {10'}. WT 5,000, RPM 60, PSI 600, SPM l14, GPM 388, FPH 20'.

01:00 02:00 1.0 MIX GEL SWEEP & CIRC TO SURFACE FOR INTEGRITY TEST.

02:00 02:30 0.5 INTEGRITY @4010', 550 PSI FOR 15 MINUTES, EMW 11 PPG.

02:30 05:30 3.0 DRLG 4010' TO 4173' {163}. WT 15,000, RPM 60, PSI 750, SPM l15, GPM 391, FPH 54.33.

05:30 06:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY@4088', 1-1/2 DEGREE.

SAFETY MEETING ON NIPPLE UP BOP, HOOKING UP HYDRAULICLINES, KEEPING FLOORS & WALKSDRY.

MIX DAP TO 6 PPG.

FORMATION GREEN RIVER, BG 0-5U, CONN 10-50U/BG, TG 80U, DT N/A.

01-09-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

O O

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 5,306 TVD 4,173 Progress 1,133 Days 11 MW 8.4 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 10:00 4.0 DRLG 4173' TO 4360' {187'}. WT 15,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 810, SPM 119, GPM 405, FPH 46.75.

10:00 10:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CK CROWN-O-MATIC.

10:30 15:30 5.0 DRLG 4360' TO 4771' {411'}. WT 15,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 810, SPM 120, GPM 408, FPH 82.20'.

15:30 16:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @4600', 1.75 DEGREES.

16:00 02:30 10.5 DRLG 4771' TO 5176' {405'}. WT 13/18, RPM 60/55, PSI 850, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 38.57'.

02:30 03:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @5085', 2 DEGREES.

03:00 06:00 3.0 DRLG 5176' TO 5306' {130'}. WT 18,000, RPM 60/55, PSI 850, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 43.33'.

FORMATION TOP WASATCH 4626' MD.

BG GAS 0-5U, CONN GAS 10-50 U, DT GAS N/A

SAFETY MEETINGS ON CHANGING LINERS & SWABS IN PUMPS, OPERATINGAIR TUGGER & GREASING
RIG.

CIRC RESERVE PIT, DAP 6 PPG.

10 DEGREES, FULL MOON, CHILL.

01-10-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling i Completion Well Total

MD 6,400 TVD 6,400 Progress 1,094 Days 12 MW 8.5 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 09:30 3.5 DRLG 5306' TO 5450' {144}. WT 20,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 871, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 41.14.

09:30 10:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CK CROWN-O-MATIC, FUNCTION PIPE RAMS, WORK KELLY & FLOOR VALVES.
10:00 14:30 4.5 DRLG 5450' TO 5669' {219}. WT 20,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 880, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 48.66'.
14:30 15:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @5585', 1.25°.

15:00 Ol:30 10.5 DRLG 5669' TO 6198' {529']. WT 20,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 900, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 50.38'.

01:30 02:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @6113', 1.25 DEGREE.

02:00 06:00 4.0 DRLG 6198' TO 6400' [202']. WT 20,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 900, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 50.5'.

01-11-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling ' Completion Well Total

MD 7,280 TVD 7,280 Progress 880 Days 13 MW 8.5 Visc 25.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD.

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 10:00 4.0 DRLG 6400' TO 6572' [172']. WT 20,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 900, SPM 125,GPM 425, FPR 43'.
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

10:00 10:30 0,5 RIG SERVICE, CK CROWN-O-MATIC, FUNCTION PIPE RAMS, WORK KELLY & FLOOR VALVES.
10:30 15:30 5.0 DRLG 6572' TO 6759" [187'], WT 20,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 925, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 37.4'.
15:30 16:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @6676', 1-3/4 DEGREE.
16:00 05:00 13.0 DRLG 6759' TO 7256' [497']. WT 20,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 730/910, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 38.23'.
05:00 05:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @7171', 1-3/4 DEGREE.
05:30 06:00 0.5 DRLG 7256' TO 7280' [24']. WT 20,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 730/910, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 48'.

FORMATION WASATCH TOP 4626', PROJECTED DARK CANYON TOP 8841'.
BG GAS 0-5U, CONN GAS 5-10U/BG, DT GAS N/A, NO SHOWS, 15% SS, 85% SHALE.

SAFTEY MEETINGS ON TRAINING NEW HANDS ON BOP DRILLS, DETECTING H2S GAS.
TWO CREWS HELD BOP DRILLS: 3 MINS 51 SEC & 2 MIN.

4 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, FULL MOON.
01-12-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling '
Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 7,756 TVD 7,756 Progress 476 Days 14 MW 8.5 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: CUT & SLIP 200' DRLG LINE, TRIP.

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 12:00 6.0 DRLG 7280' TO 7508' [228'], WT 20,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 730/960, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 38'.
12:00 12:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CK CROWN-O-MATIC, FUNCTION PIPE RAMS, WORK KELLY & FLOOR VALVES.
12:30 20:30 8.0 DRLG 7508' TO 7756'[248], WT 20,000, RPM 60/53, PSI 730/960, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 31'.
20:30 21:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @7672', 1-3/4 DEGREES. PUMP PILL, DRAIN UP FOR TRIP.
21:00 02:00 5.0 TRIP OUT OF HOLE, NO PROBLEM, HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE.

02:00 03:00 1.0 LAY DOWN BIT, CK MUD MOTOR, FUNCTION BLIND & PIPE RAMS, CK CROWN-O-MATIC.
03:00 05:00 2.0 TRIP IN HOLE TO 3906', NO PROBLEMS.
05:00 06:00 1.0 CUT & SLIP 200' DRILLING LINE, BAD SPOT IN LINE.

FORMATION WASATCH, TOP 4626'. PROJECED DARK CANYON TOP 8841'.
BG GAS 0-5U, CONN GAS 5-10U, DT GAS N/A
NO SHOWS, 25% SS, 75% SHALE

SAFETY MEETINGS ON DETECTING H2S & WHAT TO DO IF DETECTED, WORKING ON PUMPS, TRIPPING &
CUTTING DRLG LINE

WEATHER 4 DEGREES & CLEAR.

01-13-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 8,455 TVD 8,455 Progress 699 Days 15 MW 8.6 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD.

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 08:30 2.5 FINISH TRIP IN HOLE, NO PROBLEMS.
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

Ô O

08:30 09:30 1.0 BREAK CIRC, WASH & REAM 80' TO BOTTOM, 10'FILL.

09:30 12:00 2.5 DRLG 7756' TO 7848' [92']. WT 5/20, RPM 60/53, PSI 800/1050, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 36.80'.

1 .0

RDRLSGE7R848

T

8H3
' 4 ' T 8/ 0

RPCM

60/53, PSI 850/1050, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 39.25'.

00:30 01:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @8234', 1-3/4 DEG.

01:00 06:00 5.0 DRLG 8319' TO 8455' [136']. WT 16/20, RPM 60/53, PSI 850/1050, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 27.20'.

FORMATION WASATCH TOP 4626', PROJECTED DARK CANYON TOP 8841'.

BG GAS 0-5U, CONN GAS 0-5U, TRIP GAS 22U, DT GAS 5/10U/BG

NO SHOWS, 25% SS, 75% SHALE.

SAFTEY MEETING ON TRIPPING W/NEW HANDS, SLOW DOWN & THINK, KEEPING THINGS THAWED OUT

WEATHER 4 DEGREE LITE BREEZE.

USED 1026 GALS FUEL.

01-14-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling ' Completion Well Total

MD 9,115 TVD 9,115 Progress 660 Days 16 MW 8.6 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 12:00 6.0 DRLG 8455' TO 8630'[175']. WT 16/20', RPM 60/53, PSI 850/1050, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 29.

12:00 12:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CHECKED CROWN-O-MATIC, FUNCTION PIPE RAMS & WORK KELLY & FLOOR VALVES.

12:30 06:00 17.5 DRLG 8630' TO 9115'[485). WT 20/22, RPM 60/53, PSI 850/950, SPM 125, GPM 425, FPH 27.71'.

FORMATION: DARK CANYON TOP 8841'. 35% SS, 65% SHALE

BG GAS 0-10U, CONN 0-5U, DT GAS 5-10U, BGG 5-10U

SAFETY MEETINGS ON WORKING ON MUD PUMPS, A CLEAN RIG IS A HAPPY RIG, KEEPING ICE OFF
FLOORS & WALKWAYS.

WEATHER 4 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLEAR

USED 1203 GAL FUEL.

01-15-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,810 TVD 9,810 Progress 695 Days 17 MW 8.6 Visc 24.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING AT 9810'

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 12:30 6.5 DRLG 9115' TO 9314'[199']. WT 15/20, RPM 65/70, PSI 800/1000, SPM 125, GPM 425.

12:30 12:45 0.25 RIG SERVICE.

12:45 06:00 17.25 DRLG 9314' TO 9810' [496]. WT 15/20, RPM 55/70, PSI 800/1000, SPM 125, GPM 425.
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Well Name: PETþ'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

FORMATION PRICE RIVER TOP AT 9157'. 55% SS, 45% SHALE, BG GAS 5-25U, CONN 25-50U/BG, DT GAS 5-
10U, 5-10U BGG.

SAFETY MEETINGS ON HAVING SAFETY CABLES AND CHAINS ON ALL HIGH PRESSURE HOSES.
WEATHER 5 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLEAR SKYS
USED 1043 GALS FUEL.

01-16--2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,875 TVD 9,875 Progress 56 Days 18 MW 8.8 Visc 28.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 10:00 4.0 DRLG 9819' TO 9859' [40']. WT 15/20, RPM 55/70, PSI 800/1000, SPM 125, GPM 425.
10:00 12:50 2.8333 PUMPED 30 BBLS BRINE AND DROP SURVEY. TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO 4370' W/NO DRAG.

333333

12:50 13:15 0.4166 SERVICE RIG.
666667

13:15 16:00 2.75 FINISH TRIP OUT OF HOLE. LAID DOWN DRLG MOTOR AND BIT #5.
16:00 18:15 2.25 PU BIT #6 AND NEW MOTOR WITH .16 REV/GAL AND TIH TO 4571'.
18:15 19:30 1.25 SLIP 195' OF DRLG LINE DUE TO BROKEN CABLE STRANDS.
19:30 22:15 2.75 TRIP IN HOLE TO 9250', TAG UP ON TIGHT HOLE.
22:15 05:15 7.0 WASH AND REAM TIGHT HOLE 9250' TO 9454', CONT'D TIH TO 9809' TAGUP ON FILL, WASH 50' FILL TO

TD. (REAMING PARAMETERS: WT 5/15, RPM 55/70, PSI 940/1100, SPM 125, GPM 425).

05:15 06:00 0.75 DRLG 9859' TO 9875 [16], WT 15, RPM 55, PSI 1100, SPM 123, GPM 418.

FORMATION PRICE RIVER TOP 9157'. 50% SS, 50% SHALE, BG GAS 5-25U, TRIP 136U.

SAFETY MEETINGS ON REAMING DOS AND DON'TS.
WEATHER 5 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLEAR SKY.

USED 1228 GAL FUEL.

01-17-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling 3 i Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total !

MD 10,430 TVD 10,430 Progress 555 Days 19 MW 8.6 Visc 36.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 I1:30 5.5 DRLG 9875' TO 10,055' [180], WT 5/18, RPM 68/72, PSI 1100, SPM 120, GPM 408.
11:30 12:00 0.5 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE.
12:00 12:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG.
12:30 06:00 17.5 DRLG 10,055' TO 10,430'[375']. WT 12/18, RPM 68/72, PSI 1030/1180, SPM 125, GPM 425.

FORMATION: MIDDLE PRICE RIVER TOP 10,176'. 45% SS, 40% SHALE, 15% COAL, BG GAS 35-65U, CONN 50-
100U/BG, DT GAS 75-150U. 30-70U/BG.
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Well Name: PET,E'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

SHOW #1: 10,204, 1.5/2.5/1.2, PEAK 335, BG 40. SHOW #2: 10,220, 1.1/.8/1.4, PEAK 213, BG 60. SHOW #3: 10,245,
1.1/1.7/1.2, PEAK 448, BG 60. SHOW #4: 10,260, 1.3/1.5/1.2, PEAK 236, BG 60. SHOW #5: 10,292, 2.2/2.9/1.9, PEAK
204, BG 60. SHOW #6: 10,320,2.0/1.9/1.8, PEAK 216, BG 60. SHOW #7: 10,391, 2.6/1.9/1.9, PEAK 451, BG 50.

SAFETY MEETINGS ON IMPORTANCE OF EYE AND EAR PROTECTION.
WEATHER 8 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLEAR SKYS
USED 1365 GAL FUEL.

01-18-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,841 TVD 10,841 Progress 411 Days 20 MW 9.0 Visc 38.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 13:30 7.5 DRLG 10,430' TO 10,549' [119]. WT 10/20, RPM 64/70, PSI 1125/1250, SPM 120, GPM 408.
13:30 14:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG.
14:00 06:00 16.0 DRLG 10,549' TO 10,841', [292']. WT 12/18, RPM 58/65, PSI 1080/1230, SPM 118, GPM 401.

FORMATION: MIDDLE PRICE RIVER TOP 10,176'. 40% SS, 40% SHALE, 20% COAL, BG GAS 35-65U, CONN
100-300U/BG, DT GAS 100-300U.

Show#1:10,4203.5/3.0/1.9224 60 Show#2:10,449 2.6/2.5/1.3 346 60 Show#3:10,581 1.5/2.0/1.4 286 130 Show
#4: 10,656 1.2/0.9/1.5 847 125 Show #5: 10,690 4.0/1.0/2.0 924 65 Show #6: 10,745 1.5/2.1/1.6 1330 175 Show #7:
10,794 2.3/2.5/3.0 1229 160 Show #8: 10,809 2.2/2.2/2.3 2592 250 Show #9: 10,815 2.9/3.1/3.8 3759 250

01-19-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling & Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,847 TVD 10,847 Progress 6 Days 21 MW 9.2 Visc 39.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: TRIP IN HOLE

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:45 3.75 DRLG 10,841' TO 10,847'[6]. WT 12/20, RPM 55/65, PSI 1125/1500, SPM 120, GPM 408.
09:45 16:15 6.5 TRIP FOR BIT #7. LD MUD MOTOR AND BIT #6.
16:15 19:30 3.25 PU BIT #7, NEW MUD MOTOR, 4 DRILL COLLARS AND TIH TO 3970'.
19:30 20:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE, TEST PIPE AND BLIND RAMS WHEN OUT OF HOLE. ALSO TESTED CROWN-O-MATIC.
20:00 24:00 4.0 REPAIRED DRUM ON DRAWWORKS.

24:00 03:00 3.0 TRIP IN HOLE TO 9400' W/NO DRAG.
03:00 05:30 2.5 WASH/REAM FROM 9400' TO9490'.
05:30 06:00 0.5 TRIP IN HOLE TO 9606'.

FORMATION TOPS:

MIDDLE PRICE RIVER AT 10,176'. 45% SS, 45% SHALE, 10% COAL, BG GAS 500U, CONN 100-300U/BG, DT
GAS N/A.
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287Ô O

SAFETY MEETINGS ON REAMING DO'S AND DON'TS.

WEATHER 8 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLEAR SKY.

USED 1100 GAL FUEL.

DAPP CONCENTRATION 5.0 PPG.

01-20-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion ' Well Total

MD 10,996 TVD 10,996 Progress 149 Days 22 MW 9.2 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: TRIP FOR BIT #8

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 10:00 4.0 WASH/REAM FROM 9650' TO 9900'.
10:00 10:30 0.5 TRIP IN HOLE TO 10,680'.

10:30 12:00 1.5 WASH AND REAM 10,680' TO 10,847'.

12:00 15:30 3.5 DRLG 10,847' TO 10,888'[41]. WT 35/45, RPM 36/53, PSI 1400/1500, SPM 120, GPM 408.

15:30 16:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE. RUN BOP DRILL.

16:00 03:30 11.5 DRLG 10,888' TO 10,996'[108]. WT 45, RPM 35/58, PSI 1350/1500, SPM 120, GPM 408.

03:30 05:00 1.5 MIX AND PUMP WEIGHTED PILL.

05:00 06:00 1.0 PULL OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT CHANGE.

FORMATION: LOWER PRICE RIVER TOP AT 10,899'. 40% SS, 50% SHALE, 10% COAL, BG GAS 500U, CONN
100-300U/BG, DT GAS 300-500U, TRIP GAS 4009U.

SAFETY MEETINGS ON SIGNS AND DETECTION OF BLOW OUTS.
WEATHER 11 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLEAR SKY.
USED 1200 GAL FUEL.

01-21-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling
~¯

Completion Well Total

MD 11,092 TVD 11,092 Progress 245 Days 23 MW 9.3 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 10:00 4.0 FINISH TRIP OUT OF HOLE LAYING DOWN BIT #7. TEST BLIND RANS, PIPE RAMS, HYDRIL, AND HCR.

10:00 11:30 1.5 REPAIR DRAWWORKS DRUM.

I1:30 18:00 6.5 PU BIT #8 AND TIH TO 10,956'.

18:00 19:30 1.5 WASH AND REAM 10,956' TO 10,996'.

19:30 06:00 10.5 DRLG 10,996' TO l1,092'[96], WT 42/45, RPM 48/53, PSI 1400/1650,SPM 1108, GPM 367.

FORMATION LOWER PRICE RIVER TOP l1,092'

40% SS, 55% SHALE, 5% COAL

BG GAS 400/600U, CONN 300-500U/BG, DT GAS 500/1000

SAFETY MTG: EYE/EAR PROTECTION

WEATHER 16 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLEAR SKYS
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. Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

USED 1160 GAL FUEL

DAPP CONCENTRATION IS 5.0 PPG
MBT IS 0 PPG

01-22-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 11,153 TVD 11,153 Progress 61 Days 24 MW 9.3 Visc 35.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 10:00 4.0 DRLG 11,092' TO 11,102' [10], WT 42/45, RPM 48/53, PSI 1400/1650, SPM 1108, GPM 367.
10:00 16:00 6.0 PULL OUT OF HOLE TO CHECK BOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY,FOUND MUD MOTOR SEIZED UP.
16:00 19:00 3.0 PU BIT #9 AND NEW MUD MOTOR AND TRIP IN HOLE.

19:00 20:30 1.5 SLIP AND CUT 125' OF DRLG LINE.

20:30 00:00 3.5 FINISH TRIP IN HOLE.
00:00 06:00 6.0 DRLG 11,102' TO 11,153' [51], WT 25/45, RPM 48/53, PSI 1100/1200, SPM l10, GPM 367.

01-23-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion '"~ Well Total

MD 11,359 TVD 11,359 Progress 206 Days 25 MW 9.4 Visc 36.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 11:00 5.0 DRLG l1,153' TO 11,192'[39], WT 25/45, RPM 48/53, PSI 1100/1200, SPM l10, GPM 367.

ll:00 11:30 0.5 RIGSERVICE.

l l:30 06:00 18.5 DRLG 11,192' TO 11,359'[167']. WT 30/45, RPM 50/55, PSI 1200, SPM 115, GPM 391.

FORMATION CASTLEGATE TOP 11,358'. 25% SS, 75% SHALE, BG GAS 1500U, CONN 1000-2000U/BG, DT GAS
1000/3000.

SAFETY MEETING ON PROPER RIG GREASING TECHNIQUE.
WEATHER 0 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLEAR SKY.
USED 1230 GAL FUEL.

DAPP CONCENTRATION IS 5.2 PPG.

MBT IS 0 PPG.

01-24--2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion ' Well Total

MD 11,597 TVD 11,597 Progress 238 Days 26 MW 9.4 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

06:00 14:30 8.5 DRLG l1,359' TO 11,434' [75'/8.8'/HR], WT 40/45, RPM 53/58, PSI 1400, SPM 120, GPM 408.
14:30 15:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE.

15:00 06:00 15.0 DRLG l1,434' TO 11,597' [163'/l l'/HR], WT 40/45, RPM 53/58, PSI 1400, SPM 120, GPM 408.

01-25-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling i Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total f

MD 11,761 TVD 11,761 Progress 164 Days 27 MW 10.2 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TRIP FOR BIT #10

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 11:00 5.0 DRLG l1,597' TO 11,648' [51'/10.2'/HRJ,WT 35/45, RPM 53/58, PSI 1500, SPM 120, GPM 408.

11:00 11:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG, CHECK BLIND RAMS, PIPE RAMS, HYDRIL AND HCR.

11:30 23:00 11.5 DRLG 11,648'TO 11,761'[113'/9.8'lHR], WT 40/45, RPM 53/58, PSI 1500, SPM 116, GPM 395.

23:00 00:45 1.75 MIX AND PUMP PILL. DROPPED SURVEY.

00:45 06:00 5.25 TRIP FOR BIT #10 TO 1764'.

FORMATION CASTLEGATE TOP EST 11,691', 30% SS, 55% SHALE, COAL 15%.

BG GAS 1500U, CONN 1000-2000U/BG, DT GAS 2000/4000.

SAFETY MEETING ON MIXING AND HANDLING MUD MATERIAL, ALSO MSDS SHEETS.

WEATHER 25 DEGREES, 30-40 MPH WIND, SNOWING

USED 1210 GAL FUEL. DAPP CONCENTRATION IS 5.0 PPG. MBT IS 2.0 PPG.

01-26-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling I Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling
¯

Completion Well Total

MD 11,882 TVD 11,882 Progress 121 Days 28 MW 10.4 Visc 40.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TRIP OUT FOR BIT CHECK

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 FINISH TRIP OUT OF HOLE.

07:00 08:00 1.0 LAID DOWN MUD MOTOR AND BIT #9. PU NEW MOTOR AND BIT #10.

08:00 14:00 6.0 TRIP IN HOLE WITH BIT #10. WASHAND REAM 30' TO BOTTOM W/NO FILL.

14:00 16:30 2.5 DRLG l1,761' TO 11,789' [28'/1l'/HR), WT 38/42, RPM 48/57, PSI 1540/1680, SPM l15, GPM 391.

16:30 17:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE AND REPAIR ROTARY CHAIN.

17:00 03:45 10.75 DRLG 11,789' TO 11,882' [93'/8.7'/HR], WT 40/45, RPM 53/58, PSI 1500, SPM 120, GPM 408. ROP SLOWED
CONSIDERABLY, PRESSURE & TORQUE INCREASE AT 11882'.

03:45 05:00 1.25 CIRCULATEAND MIXED PILL. DROPPED SURVEYAND PUMP PILL.

05:00 06:00 1.0 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO CHECK BIT & MOTOR.

FORMATION CASTLEGATE TOP EST 11,691'. 40% SS, 55% SHALE, COAL 5%. BG GAS 1500U, CONN 1000-
2000U/BG, DT GAS 2000/4000.

SAFETY MEETING ON USING PROPER CLOTHING.

WEATHER 3 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLEAR SKY
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Well Name: PET,E'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

USED 1260 GAL FUEL.

DAPP CONCENTRATION IS 5.2 PPG AND MBT IS 3.0 PPG.
01-27-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,913 TVD 11,913 Progress 31 Days 29 MW 10.2 Visc 38.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 11:00 5.0 FINISH TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO COLLARS.
11:00 15:00 4.0 INPECTED COLLARS, LAID DOWN 4 DC'S.

15:00 16:00 1.0 TRIP IN HOLE INSPECTING REMAINING DC'S.

16:00 17:00 1.0 PU 4 MORE DC'S AND CIRCULATED THROUGH BHA.

17:00 18:00 1.0 TRÏP IN HOLE.

18:00 19:00 1.0 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.
19:00 22:15 3.25 FINISH TRIP IN HOLE.

22:15 01:00 2.75 WASHAND REAM 80' TO BOTTOM.
01:00 06:00 5.0 DRLG 11,882' TO 11,913' [31', 6.2'/HR]. WT 30/40, RPM 50/55, PSI 1500, SPM l15, GPM 391.

FORMATION CASTLEGATE TOP EST AT l1,691'. 45% SS, 50% SHALE, COAL 5%.

BG GAS 1300U, CONN 1000-2000U/BG, TRIP GAS 9762.

SAFETY MEETING ON CUTTING AND SLIPPING DRILLING LINE.

WEATHER 6 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLEAR SKIES
USED 1220 GALS FUEL.

DAPP CONCENTRATION IS 5.0 PPG. MBT IS 3.0 PPG.

01-28-2004 Reported By VINCE GUINN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 12,090 TVD 12,090 Progress 177 Days 30 MW 10.2 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 08:30 2.5 DRLG l1,913' TO 11,927'[14'/5.6'/HR]. WT 30/40, RPM 50/55, PSI 1500, SPM l15, GPM 391.

08:30 09:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG. CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC, PIPE RAMS, HYDRIL, AND HCR.
09:00 17:30 8.5 DRLG 11,927' TO 11,988' [61'/7.2'/HR]. WT 35/42, RPM 50/55, PSI 1550/1630, SPM 115, GPM 391.
17:30 18:00 0.5 REPAIR ROTARYCHAIN.

18:00 06:00 12.0 DRLG 11,988' TO 12,090' [102'l8.5'lHR). WT 30/40, RPM 50/55, PSI 1600/1680, SPM l15, GPM 391.

FORMATION SUNNYSIDE TOP EST 11,930'. 25% SS, 35% SHALE, COAL 40%
BG GAS 6700U, CONN 2000-3000U/BG, DOWN TIME GAS 2000/4000.

SAFETY MEETING ON HANDLING MUD PRODUCTS.
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Well Name: PET,E'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287O O
WEATHER 6 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLEAR SKY, USED 1050 GAL FUEL.
DAPP CONCENTRATION IS 5.2 PPG.
MBT IS 3.0 PPG.

01-29-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling ' - Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 12,150 TVD 12,150 Progress 60 Days 31 MW 10.2 Visc 38.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:00 3.0 DRLG 12,090' TO 12,11l'[21']. WT 30/40, RPM 50/55, PSI 1600/1680, SPM 115, GPM 391, FPH 7'.
09:00 09:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CK CROWN-O-MATIC, FUNCTION PIPE RAMS, WORK KELLY & FLOOR VALES, CK ANNULAR.
09:30 13:00 3.5 DRLG 12,111' TO 12,125'[14']. WT 30/40, RPM 50/55, PSI 1600/1680, SPM 115, GPM 391, FPH 4'.
13:00 20:30 7.5 PUMP PILL & TRIP OUT OF HOLE, HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE.
20:30 21:30 1.0 LAY DOWN .13 MUD MOTOR, PU .16 MUD MOTOR, FUNCTION BLIND RAMS.
21:30 03:30 6.0 TRIP IN HOLE, NO PROBLEMS, HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE, NO FILL.
03:30 06:00 2.5 DRLG 12,125' TO 12,150' [25']. 10 FPH, WT 4/5, RPM 50/60, PSI 1500/1590, SPM l15, GPM 396.

FORMATION SUNNYSIDE TOP 11,930', PROJECTED KENILWORTH @12,187'
BG GAS 1700U, CONN GAS 2000-3000/BG, TRIP GAS 8247, DT GAS 2,000-4,000.
NO SHOWS, 25% SS, 45% SHALE, 30% COAL.
VENTED TRIP GAS, 15' TO 20' FLARE

SAFETY MEETINGS ON LOCK OUT-TAG OUT, LAYING DOWN BHA, PROPER CLOTHING.
WEATHER 20 DEGREES, LITE BREEZE, CLOUDY.

USED 1020 GAL FUEL.

01-30-2004 Reported By DOUG GRlNOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total i
MD 12,400 TVD 12,400 Progress 250 Days 32 MW 10.2 Visc 38.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 08:30 2.5 DRLG 12,150' TO 12,205'[55']. 22'FPH, WT 5/12,000, RPM 50/60, PSI 1500/1650, GPM 361.
08:30 09:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CK CROWN-OMATIC, WORK PIPE RAM & ANNULAR, FUNCTION HCR.
09:00 06:00 21.0 DRLG 12,205' TO 12,400' [195']. 9.28' FPH, WT 15/22, RPM 50/60, PSI 1550/1800, GPM 361.

SAFETY MEETINGS ON CATHEADS & AIR TUGGER, TRIPPlNG SHORT HANDED, WORKING WITH
ELECTRICITY

WEATHER NICE, CLEAR & SUNNY.

FORMATION SUNNYSIDE, BG GAS 6900U, CONN GAS 2,000/3000U/BG, DT 2000/4000U/BG
30% SS, 45% SHALE, 25% COAL
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

DIVERTED THRU GAS BUSTER FROM 12,340' TO 12,398', 10-15' FLARE WHILE DIVERTING.
3'-10' FLARE WHILE VENTING.

01-31-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling * Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 12,678 TVD 12,678 Progress 278 Days 33 MW 10.6 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRLG AHEAD.

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:30 3.5 DRLG 12,400' TO 12,454' [54']. 15.42' FPH. WT 10/22, RPM 50/60, SPM 115, PSI 1600/1700, GPM 361.
09:30 10:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CK CROWN-O-MATIC, FUNCTION PIPE RAMS, HCR, WORK FLOOR & KELLY VALVES.
10:00 06:00 20.0 DRLG 12,454' TO 12,678'. 224', l l.20' FPH. WT 14/22, RPM 50/60, SPM 115, PSI 1600/1700, GPM 361.

SAFETY MEETINGS ON HOUSEKEEPING, DRLG WITH UNDER BALANCED MUD, CHANGING OIL.

FORMATION KENILWORTH TOP AT 12,585', ABERDEEN TOP EST AT 12,700'.

DIVERTING GAS THRU GAS BUSTER, ±6' FLARE.

BG GAS 3800U, CONN GAS [GOING THRU BUSTER], DT GAS N/A.

30% SS, 45% SHALE, 25% COAL.

WEATHER CLOUDY APP 1"NEW SNOW.

FUEL USED 2150 GALS

02--01-2004 ported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total ^

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 422 Days 34 MW 10.6 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP TO LOG

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 10:30 4.5 DRLG 12,678' TO 12,733'. 55', 12.22'FPH. WT 15/22, RPM 50/60, SPM 115, PSI 1700/1950, GPM 361.
10:30 11:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CK CROWN-O-MATIC, FUNCTION PIPE RAMS & HCR, WORK FLOOR & KELLYVALVES.

11:00 06:00 19.0 DRLG 12,733, TO 13'100' TD. 376', 19.3l'FPH. REACHED TD @0600HRS, 02/01/04. WT 14/22, RPM 50/60, SPM
l15, PSI 1700/1900, GPM 361.

SAFETY MEETING ON DRESSING FOR WINTER, SAFETY GLASSES, IMPORTANCE OF BOP DRILLS.
FORMATION ABERDEEN AT 12,667' EST TOP, SPRING CANYONAT ±13,100'.

BG GAS 5400, CONN [THRU GAS BUSTER] DT N/A, NO SHOWS.

30% SS, 70% SHALE.

WEATHER CLEAR, CHILLY

FUEL 1400 GALS

02-02-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling $ Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total ?
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- Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 35 MW 11.0 Visc 42.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: LOGGING W/SCHLUMBERGER.

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 08:00 2.0 CIRC & CONDITION HOLE FOR LOGS.

08:00 09:30 1.5 SHORT TRIP 15 STANDS, HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE.

09:30 10:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE, CK CROWN-O-MATIC, WORK PIPE RAMS, FUNCTION KELLY & FLOOR VALVES.
10:00 12:00 2.0 CIRC & CONDITION FOR LOGS.

12:00 19:30 7.5 RUN SURVEY. PUMPED WEIGHTED PILL. TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR LOGS. SLM NO CORRECTION. SURVEY
@13,015', 1-3/4 DEGREE.

19:30 06:00 10.5 RIG UP SCHLUMBERGER & LOGGING. RUN CNL, TLD, AIT, PR CAL. LOGGER'S TD 13,114', BHT 196
DEGREE.

FORMATION SPRING CANYON

SAFETY MEETING ON WORKING W/PRESSURE, TRIPPING & LOGGING W/SCHLUMBERGER.

WEATHER CLEAR, CHILLY.

USED 1140 GALS FUEL.

02-03-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling ' Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling i

, - Completion ^^

Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 36 MW 11.0 Visc 40.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: TOH TO LOG.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 13:00 7.0 LOGGING W/SCHLUMBERGER. RIH WITH DSI/FMI LOG. HIT OBSTRUCTION @ 10,745', ATTEMPTED TO
WORK PAST W/NO SUCCESS. LOGGED OUT FROM 10,745'.

13:00 14:00 1.0 LAY DOWN LOGGING TOOLS.

14:00 15:00 1.0 RIG SERVICE, CUT & SLIP 110'DRLG LINE.
15:00 20:00 5.0 TIH TO 10,700'.

20:00 21:00 1.0 WASHED & REAMED 10,700' TO 10,780'. BRIDGE @10,745' TOOK 5-10,000# WT TO REAM OUT. WORKED UP
& DOWN SEVERAL TIMES, CLEANED UP REAL GOOD.

21:00 21:30 0.5 TRIP TO BOTTOM.

21:30 22:00 0.5 WASH & REAM 50' TO BOTTOM, NO FILL.

22:00 01:00 3.0 CIRC & CONDITION MUD, LARGE AMOUNT OF CUTTINGS WITH BOTTOMS UP. PUMP 70 SEC/QT VIS
SWEEP, VERY LITTLE INCREASE IN CUTTINGS AT SHAKER WITH SWEEP TO SURFACE. MIXED & SPOTTED
70 SEC/QT VIS PILL TO 10,600'.

01:00 01:30 0.5 PUMP SLUG TO TRIP FOR LOGS.
Ol:30 06:00 4.5 TRIP OUT FOR LOGS, CHAIN FIRST 25 STANDSOUT.

FORMATION SPRING CANYON.

TRIP GAS 8137U, 20' FLARE AT PEAK OF TRIP GAS, CIRC THRU GAS BUSTER.

SAFETY MEETINGS ON UNLOADING TRUCKS, DRINKING FLUIDS IN COLD WEATHER, ROTATINGHEAD.
WEATHER: WARMED UP AND SNOWING PRETTY GOOD.

02-04-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 37 MW 11.0 Visc 40.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: TRIP IN HOLE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:30 2.5 TRIP OUT TO LOG.

08:30 20:00 11.5 RIG UP & LOGGING W/SCHLUMBERGER. LOGGERS TD 13,107'. RAN DSI, FMI LOG.

20:00 03:00 7.0 RAN ROTARY CORES W/SCHLUMBERGER, RECOVERED 25 CORES [100%).

03:00 04:00 1.0 RIG DOWN SCHLUMBERGER LOGGERS.

04:00 06:00 2.0 PICK UP BIT & TRIP IN HOLE. PULLED WEAR BUSHING.

RECOVERED CORES FROM 12,887.1', 12,681.7', 12,582', 12556.9', 12,491',12,484', 12,474.9', 12,471', 12437',
12434.9',12403.9',12,309', 12,298.9', 12291', 12274.1', 12,239', 12226.9', 12,128', 12038', 12018.9',12012',11,947'
I1,940', l1,706', 11,326.9'.

CORING WENT VERY WELL NO PROBLEMS, HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE.

CALLED CAROL DANIELS @UOGM. ALSO, INFORMED DENNIS INGRAM OF CASING STRING &
CEMENTING JOBS.

SAFETY MEETING ON BEING AWARE OF YOUR SURROUNDINGS, ICE PLUGS IN DP, STEAM LINES.

WEATHER SNOWING, LITE BREEZE, APP 1-1/2" SNOW

USED 810 GAL FUEL.

02-05-2004 Reported B DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 38 MW 11.0 Visc 40.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUNNING 41/2" CASING.

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 10:00 4.0 TRIP TO BOTTOM, NO PROBLEMS.

10:00 13:00 3.0 CIRC & CONDITION MUD FOR CASING, MUD WT l1.1, VIS 45, 10/12'FLARE ON BOTTOMS UP.

13:00 00:30 11.5 PUMP HEAVY PILL TO DRY UP PIPE. LD DRILL PIPE & DRILL COLLARS.

00:30 01:30 1.0 RIG UP CASERS. HELD SAFETY MEETING WICASING CREW, EVERYONE ATTENTED.

01:30 06:00 4.5 RUN 4-1/2", 11.6#/FT, HCP-110, LTC CASING. , OPTIMUM TORQUE 3020 FT-LDS. BREAK CIRC @
INTERMEDIATE CASING SHOE.

SAFETY MEETING ON PULLING WEAR RING, LAYINGDOWN DP & PICKlNG UP CASING.
WEATHER CHILLY SUNNY.

02-06-2004 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 39 MW 11.0 Visc 40.0
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- Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287O O

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 12:00 6.0 RAN 326 JTS OF 4-1/2", l l.6#/FT, HC P-110, LT&C CASING, FLOAT SHOE SET @ 13,090', FLOAT COLLAR @
13047', 22' MARKER JOINT 9033-9055', 22' MARKER JOINT 4063-4085' KB . MAKE UP TORQUE 3020 FT-LBS,
CASING WAS CLEANED & ID DRIFTED TO 3.875". RAN BOW-SPRING CENTRALIZER EVRY OTHER JOINT
TD-10600'.

12:00 14:00 2.0 CIRC CASING BEFORE CEMENTING. RECIPROCATEDCASING 38' EVERY 10 MINS, NO TIGHT SPOTS. HAD
O'TO 7' FLARE UNTIL AFTER BOTTOMS UP.

14:00 16:00 2.0 CEMENT W/SCHLUMBERGER. RECIPROCATE 38'UNTIL STARTINGTO DISPLACE W/WATER. STARTED TO
GET TIGHT, SET SHOE AT 13090'. HAD FULL RETURNS THROUGHOUT JOB. BUMPED PLUG TO 3300 PSI, 500
PSI OVER CIRC PRESSURE, FLOATS HELD.

CEMENTED WITH 570 SX (178 BBLS) OF 35/65 POZ G WITH 4% D-20, 2% D-174. 0.2% D-65, 0.2% D-46, 0.75%
D-112, 0.15% D-13, 0.25% D-29. SLURRY WEIGHT 13 PPG, YIELD l.75 CFS. MIDDLE SLURRY 345 SX (79
BBLS) 50/50 POZ G WITH 2% D-20, 0.2% D-65, 0.2% D-167, 0.1% D-46, 0.075% D-80. SLURRY WEIGHT 14.1
PPG, YIELD 1.29 CFS. TAILED IN WITH 180 SX (49 BBLS) 50/50 POZ G WITH 2% -D20, 0.2% D-65, 0.2% D-167,
0.1% D-46, 0.075% D-80, 35% D-66. SLURRY WEIGHT 14.1 PPG, YIELD 1.53 CFS. HAD FULL RETURNS. TOP OF
LEAD CEMENT ESTIMATED AT 9000', TOP OF MIDDLE SLURRY ESTIMATED AT 10620', TOP OF TAIL
CEMENT ESTIMATED AT 12000'.

16:00 18:30 2.5 RIG DOWN SCHLUMBERGER CEMENTERS, NIPPLE DOWN BOP STACK.

18:30 21:00 2.5 PICKED UP BOP STACK, SET CASING SLIPS, CASING WT WITHOUT BLOCKS 100,000#. SET 4-1/2" CASING
ON SLIPS WITH 100,000#, SLIPS SET OK. CHECKED LEL & 02 LEVELS, CUT OFF CASING, SET BOP BACK
DOWN.

21:00 23:00 2.0 CLEAN MUD TANKS. LAID DOWN KELLY. SIGNED BY TOOL PUSHER & CONSULTANT.

23:00 06:00 7.0 RIG DOWN ROTARY TOOLS & PREPARED TO MOVE TO CWU 828-9. WILL DROP FROM REPORT UNTIL
COMPLETION COMMENCES.

SAFETY MEETING ON RUNNING CASING WITH T&M CASING CREW, EVERYONE ATTENDED.

SAFETY MEETING ON CEMENTING WITH SCHLUMBERGER, EVERYONE ATTENDED.

SAFETY MEETING ON ND BOP STACK, SETTING SLIPS, CUTTING OFF CASING.

WEATHER NICE

FUEL 1000 GALS.

06:00 RELEASED RIG AT 11:00PM, 2/5/04.

CAS

02-10-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion ? Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 40 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN CBL

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 NU TUBING HEAD & BOPE. SET ANCHORS & MOVED IN FRAC TANKS. SDFN. PREP TO RUN CBL.

02-11-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287O O

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 41 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,423 - 12,498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PRESSURE BUILD UP

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RU COMPUTALOG WL. RAN CBL/VDL/GR/CCL FROM 13,030' TO 8783'. TOC @8922'±. RU SCHLUMBERGER.

TESTED CASING, BOPE & FLOW BACK MANIFOLD TO 8500 PSIG.

PERFORATED KENILWORTH FROM 12,423-24', 12,435'-37', 12,470-71', 12,475'-76', 12,482'-83', 12,490'-91' &
12,49T-98' Wl3-1/8" HSC CASING GUN @3 SPF & 120° PHASING. RDWL. NO PRESSURE INCREASE AFTER
PERFORATING. PUMPED 3 BW @4.5 BPM & 5300 PSIG. BREAK DOWN PRESSURE 5419 PSIG. ISIP 4700 PSIG.
RD SCHLUMBERGER. FLOWED BACK 4 BLW. SI. SDFN.

02-12-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling : Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 42 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,423 - 12,498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC KENILWORTH ZONE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 3400 PSIG. FLOWED 8 HRS ON AN OPEN CHOKE. FCP 0 PISG. RECOVERED 120BLW. FLOWED 14 HRS
ON 12/64" CHOKE. AT 6 AM,.FCP 80 PSIG. 64 MCFD. NO FLUID. PREP TO FRAC.

02-13-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total 9

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 43 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,423 - 12,498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FCP 80 PSIG. 12/64" CHOKE. NO FLUID. 64 MCFD. RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASING W/5000

GALS YF125ST PAD, 48,216 GALSYF125ST & YF120ST, &l68,497#20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. (10 GPM SCALE
INHIBITOR YF125ST). MTP 8119 PSIG. MTR 42.1 BPM. ATP 6648 PSIG. ATR 36.6 BPM. ISIP 5960 PSIG. RD
SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED 17 HRS. AT 5 AM, 16/64" CHOKE, FCP 550 PSIG, 2-3 BLWPH. RECOVERED 936 BLW, 523 BLWTR.

02-14-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion ' Daily Total î
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total I

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 44 MW 0,0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,423 - 12,498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. AS FOLLOWS:

TIME CHOKE FCP BFPH BLWR BLWTR GAS REMARKS
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Well Name: PE'TE'S WASH 3'2-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

0600 16/64 600 3 939 550 882
0700 16/64 500 3 942 547 735
0800 16/64 450 20 962 527 662

0900 16/64 600 0 962 527 882
1000 16/64 450 0 962 527 662
1100 16/64 350 0 962 527 515

1200 16/64 350 0 962 527 515
1300 16/64 300 0 962 527 441
1400 10/64 500 0 962 527 277 INSTALLED 10/64" CHOKE @ 13:30
1500 10/64 550 0 962 527 304

1600 10/64 450 0 962 527 249
1700 10/64 425 0 962 527 235

1800 10/64 500 0 962 527 277
1900 10/64 600 0 962 527 332

2000 10/64 550 0 962 527 304
2100 10/64 525 0 962 527 290
2200 10/64 450 0 962 527 249
2300 10/64 450 3 965 524 249
2400 10/64 575 0 965 524 318

0100 10/64 550 0 965 524 304

0200 10/64 475 0 965 524 263
0300 10/64 400 0 965 524 221

0400 10/64 575 10 975 514 318
0500 10/64 700 0 975 514 387

02 15-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion

. Well Total
MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 45 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,423 - 12,498 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS AS FOLLOWS:

TIME CHOKE FCP BWPH BLWR BLWTR GAS REMARKS
0600 10/64 625 0 975 514 346
0700 10/64 625 0 975 514 346
0800 10/64 550 0 975 514 304
0900 10/64 580 0 975 514 321
1000 10/64 520 0 975 514 288
1100 10/64 480 0 975 514 266
1200 10/64 460 0 975 514 254
1300 10/64 610 2 977 512 333
1400 10/64 550 0 977 512 304
1500 10/64 510 0 977 512 282
1600 10/64 470 0 977 512 260
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- Well Name: PETFS WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287* O

1700 10/64 440 0 977 512 243
1800 10/64 400 0 977 512 221

1900 10/64 430 7 984 505 244

2000 10/64 500 0 984 505 277

2100 10/64 480 2 986 503 265
2200 10/64 460 0 986 503 254

2300 10/64 450 0 986 503 249

2400 10/64 430 0 986 503 238

0100 10/64 400 4 990 499 221

0200 10/64 530 0 990 499 293

0300 10/64 560 0 990 499 309
0400 10/64 500 0 990 499 277

0500 10/64 460 3 993 496 254

02-16-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 46 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,423 - 12,498 PKR Depth : 0,0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS AS FOLLOWS:

TIME CHOKE FCP BFPH BLWR BLWTR GAS REMARKS
0600 10/64 460 0 993 496 254
0700 10/64 390 3 996 493 216

0800 10/64 590 0 996 493 326

0900 10/64 500 0 996 493 277

1000 10/64 420 12 1008 481 232

1100 10/64 530 7 1015 474 293

1200 10/64 550 0 1015 474 304

1300 10/64 580 0 1015 474 321
1400 10/64 440 15 1030 459 243

1500 10/64 360 12 1042 447 199

1600 10/64 580 3 1045 444 321

1700 10/64 780 0 1045 444 431

1800 10/64 790 0 1045 444 437
1900 10/64 780 0 1045 444 431

2000 10/64 580 0 1045 444 321

2100 10/64 580 0 1045 444 321
2200 10/64 510 0 1045 444 282

2300 10/64 500 0 1045 444 277

2400 10/64 430 2 1047 442 238
0100 10/64 370 3 1050 439 205
0200 10/64 460 2 1052 437 254

0300 10/64 620 0 1052 437 343
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- Well Name: PETE'S WASH32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287O O
0400 10/64 600 0 1052 437 332

0500 10/64 510 0 1052 437 282
02-17-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 47 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,423- 12,498 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS AS FOLLOWS:

TIME CHOKE FCP BFPH BLWR BLWTR GAS
0600 10/64 430 4 1056 433 238

0700 10/64 490 6 1062 427 271

0800 10/64 470 0 1062 427 260

0900 10/64 420 0 1062 427 232

1000 10/64 410 0 1062 427 227
1100 10/64 320 6 1068 421 177

1200 10/64 420 8 1076 413 232

CAROL SCOTT WITH BLM ON LOCATION TO CHECK CHOKE & CHARTS
1300 10/64 600 2 1078 411 332

1400 10/64 700 0 1078 411 387

1500 10/64 700 0 1078 411 387
1600 10/64 680 0 1078 411 376
1700 10/64 650 0 1078 411 360

1800 10/64 630 0 1078 411 348
LEFT FLOWING TO PIT ON 10/64" CHOKE.

02-18-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total ?

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total ?

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 48 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PRTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BREAK DOWN SUNNYSIDE ZONE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 12 HRS. AT 6 AM, 10/64" CHOKE, FCP 600 PSIG, 332 MCFD, OBFPH. 411 BLWTR.

RU COMPUTALOG WL. RAN 3.750" GAUGE RING TO 12,332'. RIH W/WEATHERFORD COMPOSITE BP. SET
DOWN @12,104'. POH W/BP. FLOWED WELL 2 HRS. RECOVERED TRACE OF SAND. RIH W/COMPOSITE BP,
SET @12,365'.

PERFORATED SUNNYSIDE FROM 12,208-09', 12,227-28', 12,234-35', 12,242-43', 12,268-69', 12,274-75', 12,291-
92', 12,299' & 12,330-31' W/3-l/8" HSC CASING GUN @3 SPF & 120° PHASING. SICP 0 PSIG. RDWL.

02-19-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling i Completion Daily Total '
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287O O

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 49 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST SUNNYSIDE ZONE

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 1900 PSIG. RU SCHLUMBERGER. BROKE DOWN FORMATION W/20 BBLS TREATED WATER@5.3 BPM

& 4660 PSIG. ISIP 4406 PSIG. FRAC DOWN CASING W/5000 GALSYF125ST PAD, 67,662 GALS YFl25ST &
YF120ST W/232,100#20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. (10 GPM SCALE INHIBITOR INYFl25ST). MTP 8445 PSIG. MTR
48.7 BPM. ATP 6193 PSIG. ATR 41.9 BPM. ISIP 6287 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED 15 HRS ON 10/64" TO 16/64" CHOKE. AT 6 AM, 16/64" CHOKE, FCP 800 PSIG, 35 BFPH. RECOVERED
655 BLW. I 104 BLWTR.

02-20-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 50 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED FOR 13 HRS ON 16/64 TO OPEN CHOKE. FCP 0 PSIG. 15-20 BFPH 1027 BLWR. 732 BLWTR. FLUID
HIGHY GAS CUT. VERY LITE TRACE OF SAND. SHUT WELL IN @ 18:00.

02-21-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion ¯
Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 51 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN PRODUCTION TUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 500 PSIG. FLOWED I1 HRS ON OPEN CHOKE. FCP 0 PSIG. 5-20 BFPH. 660 BLWTR. MIRUSU. SDFN.

02-22-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling $1 Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total $1

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 52 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SHUT DOWN FOR WEEKEND

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 600 PSIG. BLEW WELL DOWN. RIH W/BIT, PUMP OFF SUB, & 2-3/8", 4.7#, N-80 TUBING. TAGGEDFILL

@11,901'. SDFW.

02-24-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling i Completion ' Well Total S

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 53 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 2500 PSIG. BLEW WELL DOWN. RIH. WASHED SAND FROM 12026' TO 12365'. DRILLED OUT
WEATHERFORD COMPOSITE BP. RIH. WASHED SAND FROM 12383' TO 12815'. LANDED TUBING @ 12537'
KB. ND BOPE. NU TREE. DROPPED BALL. PUMPED OFF BIT & SUB.

TUBING DETAIL: LENGTH

PUMP OFF SUB 1.54'

1 JT. 2-3/8" 4.7# N80 EUE TUBING 32.48'

XN NIPPLE 1.25'

388 JTS. 2-3/8" 4.7#N80 TUBING 12489.98'

BELOW KB 12.00'

TUBING LANDED AT 12537.25'

FLOW TESTED AS FOLLOWS:

TIME CHOKE FTP CP BFPH BLWR BLWTR GAS

18:00 12/64 600 700 0 3498 771

19:00 12/64 1000 600 35 3533 736

20:00 12/64 1000 1000 12 3545 724

21:00 12/64 1000 1000 10 3555 714 804

22:00 12/64 700 1400 10 3565 704 563

23:00 12/64 1100 1250 10 3575 694 884

24:00 12/64 1500 1300 10 3585 684 1,206

01:00 12/64 1450 1400 10 3595 674 1,166

02:00 12/64 1400 1500 10 3605 664 1,126

03:00 12/64 1400 1550 5 3610 659 1,126

04:00 12/64 1350 1500 3 3613 656 1,085

05:00 12/64 1350 1650 2 3615 654 1,085

02--25-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling ! Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling & Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 54 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW TESTED AS FOLLOWS:

TIME CHOKE FTP CP BFPH BLWR BLWTR GAS

06:00 12/64 1350 1700 5 3620 649 1,080

07:00 12/64 1300 1700 5 3625 644 1,045

08:00 12/64 1250 1850 5 3630 639 1,005

09:00 12/64 1250 1900 5 3635 634 1,005

10:00 12/64 1200 1950 5 3640 629 965

11:00 12/64 1200 2000 10 3650 619 965
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Well Name: PETFS WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

12:00 12/64 1200 2100 10 3660 609 965

13:00 12/64 1150 2100 10 3670 599 925
14:00 12/64 1150 2150 10 3680 589 925

15:00 12/64 1000 2150 15 3695 574 804

16:00 12/64 1200 2250 10 3705 564 965

17:00 16/64 1000 2200 10 3715 554 1,470

18:00 16/64 900 2200 10 3725 544 1 ,323

19:00 16/64 1000 2100 15 3740 529 1,470

20:00 16/64 1000 1950 10 3750 519 1,470

21:00 16/64 850 1900 5 3755 514 1,250

22:00 16/64 800 1850 5 3760 509 1,176

23:00 16/64 800 1700 5 3765 504 1,176

24:00 16/64 800 1650 3 3768 501 1,176

01:00 16/64 800 1750 3 3771 498 1,176

02:00 16/64 800 1700 3 3774 495 1,176

03:00 16/64 750 1650 2 3776 493 1,103

04:00 16/64 700 1650 2 3778 491 1,029

05:00 16/64 700 1600 2 3780 489 1,029

02-26-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling ' Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 55 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED AS FOLLOWING CHART.

TIME CHOKE FTP CP BFPH BLWR BLWTR GAS

06:00 16/64 700 1700 2 3782 487 1,029

07:00 16/64 650 1700 2 3784 485 956

08:00 16/64 700 1700 2 3786 483 1,029

09:00 16/64 700 1550 2 3788 481 1,029

10:00 16/64 650 1550 1 3789 480 956

l 1:00 16/64 650 1550 1 3790 479 956

12:00 16/64 650 1550 1 3791 478 956

13:00 16/64 650 1550 1 3792 477 956

14:00 16/64 650 1550 1 3793 476 956

15:00 16/64 600 1500 2 3795 474 882

16:00 16/64 625 1500 2 3797 472 919

17:00 16/64 600 1500 2 3799 470 882

18:00 16/64 600 1500 2 3801 468 882

19:00 16/64 600 1500 2 3803 466 882

20:00 16/64 600 1500 2 3805 464 882

21:00 16/64 600 1500 1 3806 463 882

22:00 16/64 600 1500 l 3807 462 882
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- Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287O O
23:00 16/64 250 1600 0 3807 462 294
24:00 OPEN 0 2000 0 3807 462 0
01:00 OPEN 0 2050 0 3807 462 0
02:00 OPEN 0 2250 0 3807 462 0
03:00 SHUT 0 2400 0 3807 462 0
04:00 SHUT 0 2600 0 3807 462 0
05:00 SHUT 0 2800 0 3807 462 0

02-27-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 56 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208--12498 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: WELL SHUT IN

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 SHUT WELL IN @07:00.

TIME CHOKE TP CP

06:00 CLOSED 0 2900

07:00 CLOSED 0 3000

02-28-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 57 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 0 PSIG. CP 5700 PSIG. RU HOT OILER. PUMPED 45 BBLS WATER DOWN TUBING. PRESSURE

INCREASED TO 1000 PSIG BEFORE TUBING OBSTRUCTION CAME FREE. PUMPED ADDITIONAL 5 BW.
FLOW TESTED AS FOLLOWS:

TIME CHOKE FTP CP BFPH ACC. BBLS MCFD REMARKS

10:00 24/64 900 2750 3,060
11:00 24/64 1100 1900 3,740 INSTALL 16/64
12:00 16/64 900 1900 1,323

13:00 16/64 1100 1900 1,617
14:00 16/64 1300 2100 CHOKE FREEZING
15:00 16/64 1500 2200 CHOKE FREEZING
16:00 16/64 1100 2400 1,617

17:00 16/64 1100 2250 2 2 1,617
18:00 16/64 1200 2000 2 4 CHOKE PLUGGING
19:00 16/64 1100 2000 2 6 1,617
20:00 16/64 1000 2000 20 26 1,470
21:00 16/64 1000 1900 20 46 1,470
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287O O

22:00 16/64 850 1800 20 66 1,250

23:00 16/64 800 1700 15 81 1,176
24:00 16/64 800 1700 15 96 1,176

01:00 16/64 900 1800 15 111 1,323
02:00 16/64 900 2050 10 121 1,323

03:00 16/64 850 2050 10 131 1,323

04:00 16/64 800 2400 10 141 1,176

05:00 16/64 750 2300 5 146 1,103

NOTE: FROM 17:00 TO 05:00 CHOKE PLUGGED INTERMITTENTLY WIPIECES OF COMPOSITE BP.

02-29-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling $ Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 58 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW TESTED AS FOLLOWS:

TIME CHOKE FTP CP BFPH ACC GAS REMARKS

06:00 16/64 1350 2000 5 151 CHOKE PLUGGED

07:00 16/64 900 2000 5 156 1,323

08:00 16/64 700 1500 10 166 1,029

09:00 16/64 800 1500 10 176 1,176

10:00 16/64 750 1600 10 186 1,103

11:00 16/64 700 1800 8 194 1,029

12:00 16/64 800 1800 8 202 1,176

13:00 16/64 950 1600 10 212 1,397

14:00 16/64 750 1600 8 220 1,103

15:00 16/64 700 1600 5 225 1,029

16:00 16/64 700 1600 5 230 1,029

17:00 16/64 700 1600 5 235 1,029

18:00 16/64 700 1600 5 240 1,029

19:00 16/64 700 1600 5 245 1,029

20:00 16/64 700 1600 5 250 1,029

21:00 16/64 700 1600 3 253 1,029

22:00 16/64 700 1600 3 256 1,029

23:00 16/64 700 1600 3 259 1,029

24:00 16/64 800 1600 3 262 1,176

01:00 16/64 500 1700 3 265 735

02:00 16/64 850 1600 3 268 1,250

0:300 16/64 700 1400 3 271 1,029

04:00 16/64 600 1400 3 274 882

05:00 16/64 550 1400 2 276 809
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

03-01-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 59 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW TESTED AS FOLLOWS:

TIME CHOKE FTP CP BFPH ACC GAS REMARKS

06:00 16/64 550 1400 5 281 809
07:00 16/64 750 1500 5 286 1,103

08:00 16/64 750 1700 5 291 1,103

09:00 16/64 1050 1600 5 296 CHOKE PLUGGED

10:00 16/64 750 1400 5 301 1,103

ll:00 16/64 550 1400 5 306 809

12:00 16/64 550 1400 5 311 809

13:00 16/64 550 1350 5 316 809

14:00 16/64 550 1350 5 321 809

15:00 16/64 550 1350 5 326 809

16:00 16/64 550 1350 5 331 809

17:00 16/64 500 1350 5 336 735

18:00 16/64 500 1300 3 339 735

19:00 16/64 500 1300 3 342 735
20:00 16/64 500 1300 3 345 735

21:00 16/64 500 1300 3 348 735

22:00 16/64 500 1300 3 351 735

23:00 16/64 500 1300 1 352 735
24:00 16/64 500 1300 1 353 735

01:00 16/64 500 1300 1 354 735

02:00 16/64 500 1300 1 355 735
03:00 16/64 500 1300 1 356 735

04:00 16/64 500 1300 1 357 735

05:00 16/64 500 1300 1 358 735

03-02-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 60 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW TESTED AS FOLLOWS:
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Well Name: PET,E'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

TIME CHOKE FTP CP BFPH ACC MCFD REMARKS

06:00 16/64 500 1300 1 359 735
07:00 16/64 500 1300 1 360 735
08:00 16/64 500 1250 2 362 735
09:00 16/64 550 1250 3 365 809
10:00 16/64 600 1300 2 367 882
11:00 16/64 650 1350 3 370 956
12:00 16/64 650 1350 3 373 956
13:00 16/64 650 1300 2 375 956
14:00 16/64 525 1300 2 377 772
15:00 16/64 500 1250 3 380 735
16:00 16/64 500 1200 2 382 735
17:00 16/64 500 1200 1 383 735
18:00 16/64 500 1200 1 384 735
19:00 16/64 500 1200 1 385 735
20:00 16/64 500 1200 1 386 735
21:00 16/64 500 1200 1 387 735
22:00 16/64 500 1200 1 388 735
23:00 16/64 500 1200 TRACE 388 735
24:00 16/64 500 1200 0 388 735

01:00 16/64 500 1200 0 388 735
02:00 16/64 500 1200 0 388 735

03:00 16/64 500 1200 0 388 735

04:00 16/64 500 1200 0 388 735

05:00 16/64 500 1200 0 388 735
03-03-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling ? Completion Daily Total §
Cum Costs: Drilling i Completion Well Total
MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 61 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: WELL SI

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW TEST 2 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FTP 500 PSIG. CP 1200 PSIG. 735 MCFD. O BFPH. SI.

03-06-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion '

Well Total
MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 56 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FRAC BLACKHAWK

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 14:00 8.0 MIRU K&S WELL SERVICE. SITP 2700 PSIG. SICP 5000 PSIG. BLEW WELL DOWN. KILLED WELL WITH

TREATED WATER. ND TREE & NU 10M PSIG BOPE. POH. SDFN.
03-07-2004 Reported By SEARLE

Page



Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

DailyCosts: Drilling ? Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 57 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : KENILWORTH PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 12,208-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PERF BLACKHAWK

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 17:00 10.0 SICP 2000 PSIG. BLEW CASING DOWN TO 900 PSIG. PUMPED 30 BBLS TREATEDWATERDOWN CASING.
SICP l100 PSIG. RU CUTTERS WL. RIH W/10K COMPOSITE BP & SET DOWN @11,402'. BP STUCK. FLOWED
30 MIN ON 24/64" CHOKE. FCP 400 PSIG. WORKED WL WITH NO MOVEMENT. LOADED HOLE W/130 BBLS
TREATED WATER. CP 2800 PSIG. WORKED WL WITH NO MOVEMENT. SET BP. RDWL. BLEW WELL DOWN.
RIH W/3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUB. DRILLED OUT BP @ l1,402'. RIH TO 12,530'. POH TO 12,155'. SDFN.

03-08-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling I Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling ' Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 58 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: FRAC BLACKHAWK

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 16:30 10.5 SITP 600 PSIG. SICP 2900 PSIG. FLOWED 3 HRS. 12/64"-32/64" CHOKES. FTP 0 PSIG. CP 400 PSIG. KILLED
WELL WITH TREATED WATER. POH.

RUWL. SET 10K COMPOSITE BP @12,082'. TESTED BP TO 5000 PSIG. PERFORATED BLACKHAWK FLUVIAL
FROM @ ll,940'-42', I1,964'-65', ll,982'-83', 12,003'-04', 12,011'-13', 12,037'-39'& 12,052'-53' W/3-l/8" HSC
PORTED CASING GUNS @3 SPF & 120°PHASING. RDWL. PUMPED 5 BBLS TREATED WATER @ 1.2 BPM &
5000 PSIG. ISIP 4800 PSIG.

FLOWED 30 MINS THROUGH OPEN CHOKE. RECOVERED 140 BLW. FLOWED 30 MIN THROUGH 32/64"
CHOKE. FCP 225 PSIG. 6-8 BFPH. RECOVERED 4 BLW. 46 BLWTR. SDFN.

03-09-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 59 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 900 PSIG. FLOWED 50 MINS. FCP 0 PSIG. NO FLUID. 4'-5' FLARE THROUGH 2" LINE.

RU SCHLUMBERGER. LOADED HOLE W/160 BBLS SLICK WATER. FRAC BLACKHAWK FLUVIAL DOWN
CASING W/4953 GALSYFl25ST PAD, 41,908 GALSYFl25ST &YFll8ST & 163,721#20/40 SAND @ 1-6 PPG. 10
GAL/M SCALE INHIBITOR INYF125ST STAGES. MTP 7957 PSIG. MTR 46.6 BPM. ATP 1097 PSIG. ATR 42.1
BPM. ISIP 5200 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED 18 HRS ON 10/64-12/64" CHOKES. AT 5 AM, 12/64" CHOKE, FCP 1300 PSIG, 8-10 BFPH, TRACE OF
SAND. RECOVERED 1130 BLW. 415 BLWTR.

03-10-2004 Reported By SEARLE
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Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287O O

DailyCosts: Drilling I Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total $

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 60 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: DRILL OUT PLUG

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS ON 24/64" CHOKE. FCP 200 PSIG. 4-6 BFPH. RECOVERED 265 BLW. 150 BLWTR.

PRESSURE STABLE LAST 8 HRS.

03-11-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling -, Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 61 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FCP 200 PSIG. KILLED WELL W/60 BBLS TREATED WATER. RIH W/3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUB. CLEANED

OUT FROM 12,050' TO BP @ 12,082'. DRILLED OUT BP. RIH TO 12,700'. LANDED TUBING @ 12,537' KB. ND
BOPE. NU TREE. DROPPED BALL. PUMPED OFF BIT. RDMO SU.

FLOWED 15 HRS ON 16/64" CHOKE. FTP 850 PSIG. CP 1100 PSIG. 2-3 BFPH. STEADY FLARE. RECOVERED
295 BLW. 170 BLWTR.

03-12--2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling ' Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 62 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: SHUT IN

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 15:00 9.0 FLOWED 9 HRS ON 16/64" CHOKE. AT 3 PM, FTP 700 PSIG, CP 1300 PSIG, 2-3 BFPH. RECOVERED 36 BLW. 134

BLWTR. SI. WILL DROP FROM REPORT WHILE WO FACILITIES.

FINAL COMPLETION DATE: 3/11/04

06--17-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling 5 Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 63 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: INITIAL PRODUCTION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 OPENING PRESSURE: TP 4200 & CP 4200 PSIG. TURNED WELL TO QUESTAR SALES AT4:00 PM, 6/16/04.

FLOWING 650 MCFD ON 10/64" POS CK.
Page



. Well Name: PETß'S WASH 3i-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287e e
06-18-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling & Completion Well Total
MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 64 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 679 MCFD, 4 BC & 152BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CHOKE, TP 3550 PSIG, CP 4450 PSIG.

06-21-2004 Reported By GEORGE MCBRIDE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 65 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 6/19/04 - FLOWED 766 MCF, 16 BC & 97 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, FTP 3350 & CP 4150 PSIG.

6/20/04 - FLOWED 760 MCF, 0 BC & 168 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, FTP 2800 & CP 3600 PSIG.

6/21/04 - FLOWED 698 MCF, 4 BC & 123 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, FTP 2550 & CP 3300 PSIG.

06--22-2004 Reported By GEORGE MCBRIDE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 66 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 656 MCF, 5 BC & 117 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, FTP 2400 & CP 3150 PSIG.

06-23-2004 Reported By GEORGE MCBRIDE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 67 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 603 MCF, 0 BC & 142BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, FTP 2250 & CP 3000 PSIG.

06-24-2004 Reported By GEORGE MCBRIDE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion S' Daily Total

Page



. Well Name: PETE'S WASH 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287O O
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $ Well Total
MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 68 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 586 MCF, 4 BC & 98 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, FTP 2200 & CP 2950 PSIG.

06-25-2004 Reported By GEORGE MCBRIDE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 69 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 570 MCF, 0 BC & 78 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, FTP 2150 & CP 2850 PSIG.

06-28--2004 Reported By GEORGE MCBRIDE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling ' Completion Well Total

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 70 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : I1940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 6/26/04 - FLOWED 551 MCF, 5 BC & 86 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, FTP 2050 & CP 2700 PSIG.

6/27/04 - FLOWED 522 MCF, 3 BC & 87 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, FTP 2000 & CP 2650 PSIG.

6/28/04 -FLOWED 515 MCF, 2 BC & 58 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, FTP 2000 & CP 2625 PSIG. WILL UPSIZE
CHOKE TODAY.

06-29-2004 Reported By GEORGE MCBRIDE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 71 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 499 MCF, 0 BC & 103 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, FTP 1975 & CP 2600 PSIG. LP 718 PSIG. CHANGED

CHOKE TO 12/64".

06-30-2004 Reported By GEORGE MCBRIDE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion ' Well Total

Page



- Well Name: PETE'S WASH32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287O O
MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 72 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : BLACKHAWK PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 11940-12053 PKR Depth : 0.0
FLUVIAL

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 608 MCF, 5 BC & 130 BW IN 24 HRS ON 12/64" CK, FTP 1300 & CP 2050 PSIG. LP 705 PSIG.

Page



0 6
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
ÛÍ $ DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UT-ST-ML 47068
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UN]TorCA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drillnewwells, significantlydeepen existing wells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, orto PETE'S WASHdrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMlT TO DRlLLform forsuch proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL

OILWELL O GAS WELL OTHER PE ES H 3 -2

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC 4301332453
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WlLDCAT:
P.O. BOX 250 a...,. BIG PINEY STATE ZIP83113 (307) 276-3331 WILDCAT

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 2049 FNL - 1959 FWL COUNTY: DUCHESNE

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SENE 2 11S 16E STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPA1R NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVlOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: Water/Gas Analysis
O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see the attached water/gas analysis for the referenced well.

RECEIVED
JUL21 2004

DNOFOIL,GAS&MINING

NAMNE(PLEAS T Alfreda Schulz TE Sr eg0ulatoryAssistant

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



Jul-19-2004 09:45am From-EOGRESOUR +14357897838 T-253 P.002/002 781e
'

. y Charnpion waterAnalysisRepon Date Sampled

04

A Technologies Dam Received :
1S-N-04

Committed 70 IfnpfDV ineuf Date Reported : 19-Jul-04

EOG
9 Field : Petes Wash

Lease : Petes Wash

UT Location ; Petes Wash 32-02

Attention : George McBride Sample Point : wellhead

cci : Salesman : Ed Schwara

ec2 :

cc3 :
Analyst : Karen HawkinsAII

Comments : AGID GASES RAN IN LAB.

CATIONS ANIONS

Calcium : 504 mg/l Chloride : 11,600 mg/I

Magnesium : 63 mgli carbonate : O mg/l

Barium : mgli
strontium: mg/l Bicarbonate : 1.171 mg/l

Iron : 40 mg/1 sulfate : 213 mg/l
Manganese : mgil

Sodium : 7369 mg/I

pl•I (field) : 6.97 Specific Gravity : 1.015 grams/ml

Temperature : 85 degrees F Total Dissolved Solids : 20,934 ppm

Ionic Strength : 0.35 CO2 In water : 300 mall

GO2 in Gas : 0.03 mole %

Resistivity : ohm/meters H2S in Water : mg/l

Ammonia : ppm Dissolved Oxygen : ppm

SI calculations based on Tomson-Oddoparameters

Caleite (CaCO3) SI : -0.29
Calette PTB : NIA

Calcite (CaCO3) SI @ 100 F : -0.13 Calcite PTS @ 100 F : N/A

Calcite (CaCO3) SI @ 120 F : 0.08 Calcite PTB @120 F : 34.4

Calcite (CaCO3) SI @ 140 F : 0.30 Calcite PTB @ 140 F : 117.1

Calcite (CaCO3) SI @ 160 F : 0.52 Calcite PTB @ 160 F : 185.9

Galcite (GaCO3) SI @ 180 F : 0.75 Calcite PTB @180 F : 246,2

Calcite (CaCO3) SI @200 F : 0.99 Calcite PTB@200 F : 296.1

Gypsum (CaSO4) Sl : -1.62
Gypsum PTS : N/A

Barite (BaSO4) SI : N/A Barite PTB : N/A

Celestite (SrSO4) SI : N/A Celestite PTS : NIA

Confidential
ChampionTechnologies, Inc.
Vernal DistrictTechnical Services Page 1 of 1

Received JuHO-04 10:30am From-+14357897633 To-EOG- BIGPINEY,WY. Page



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISlON OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
UT-ST-ML-47068

6. IF 1NDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

7. UN1Tor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to PETE'S WASH UNITdrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER PETE'S WASH 32-2

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC 4301332453
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
P.O. BOX 250 , BIG PINEY WY 83113 (307) 276-3331 WILDCAT

4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 2049 FNL - 1959' FEL COUNTY: DUCHESNE

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SWNE 2 11S 16E S STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF lNTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARlLY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOFWELLSITE OTHER: CONTINUED
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION COMPLETION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

EOG Resources, Inc. continued completion in the Mesaverde formation of the referenced well as follows:
1. Set composite frac plug @ 11,660'. Perforated the Lower Price River from 11,470-73', 11,506-08', 11,555-57', 11,564-66' &
11,616-18' w/2 SPF. Fracture stimulated with 1129 bbis gelled water & 168,720 #20/40 sand.
2. Set composite frac plug @ 11,435'. Perforated the Lower Price River from 11,313-15', 11,325-28', 11,365-67' & 11,404-06'
wl3 SPF. Fracture stimulated with 983 bbis gelled water & 131,250 # 20/40 sand.
3. Set composite frac plug @ 11,260'. Perforated the Middle Price River from 10,973-76', 10,996-98', 11,052-54', 11,077-79' &
11,197-11,200' w/2 SPF. Fracture stimulated with 1109 bbis gelled water & 144,180 # 20/40 sand.
4. Set composite frac plug @ 10,945'. Perforated the Middle Price River from 10,811-12', 10,818-19', 10,824-25', 10,828-29',
10,855-57', 10,880-81', 10,888-89', 10,897-98', 10,903-04' & 10,931-32' w/2 SPF. Fracture stimulated with 1247 bbls gelled
water & 146,300 # 20/40 sand.
5. Drilled out frac plugs @ 10,945', 11,260', 11,435', 11,660'. Landed tubing@ 11,550'. Returned to sales 8/14/2004 through
Questar meter # 688 volume will be allocated to EOG monthly. TEST: 399 MCFD, 0 BC, 94 BW in 24 hours on 12/64 choke,
TP 1000 PSIG, CP 1750 PSIG.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) ALFREDASCHULZ TITLE SR. REGULATORY ASSISTANT

SIGNATURE ).I DATE 8/18/2004

(Thîs space for State use or

RECE D
AUS23 2004

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DN,0F0lL,G|Gå



eog resources EOG Resources, Inc.
600 Seventeenth Street
Suite 1100N
Denver, CO 80202

February 3, 2005 "2°°s4co

Utah Division of Oil, Gas, & Mining
1594 West North Temple.
Vernal, UT 84078

RE: Petes Wash 32-02 L/ y
~ $ $N

T11S-R16E-Sec. 02
Uintah County, Utah

Ms.Carol Daniels:

Enclosed herewith are the following logs and data associated with the subject well:

Petes Wash 32-02
rray Induction WILinear Correlation GR 01-05-04 (2)

Compensated Neutron Triple Litho Density GR 01-05-04 (2)
icrolog GR 01-05-04 (2)
ipole Shear Sonic Imager GR 01-05-04 (2)

Second run
rray Induction WILinear Correlation GR 02-01-04 (2)

\ ompensated Neutron Triple Litho Density GR 02-01-04 (2)
icrolog GR 02-01-04 (2)

\ËipoleSonic Imager GR 02-01-04 (2)

Ifyou have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Very trulyyours,

EOG RESOURCES, INC.

RECEIDelores Montoya VED
Exploration & Operations Secretary FEB09 205Denver Office

DIVOFOIL,GAS&MININGEnc.16
cc: Well File

energy opportunity



State of Utah
its ? DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

--..,,,-- MICHAEL R. STYLER
GARY R. HERBERT Executive Director

Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GREGORY S. BELL JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Govemor Division Director

March 2, 2011

CERTIFIED MAIL NO.: 7004 1160 0003 0190 4970

Ms. Kaylene Gardner ii
EOG Resources, Inc. ¿‡&5 46h 32. 2
1060 East Highway 40 $ p 6 2
Vernal, UT 84078

Subject: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned Well Requirements for Fee or State Leases

Dear Ms. Gardner:

As of January 2011, EOG Resources, Inc. has three (3) State Lease Wells (see attachment
A) that are currently in non-compliance with the requirements for extended shut-in or
temporarily abandoned (SI/TA) status.

Wells SI/TA beyond twelve (12) consecutive months requires filing a Sundry Notice
(R649-3-36-1). Wells with five (5) years non-activity or non-productivity shall be plugged,
unless the Division grants approval for extended shut-in time upon a showing of good cause by
the operator (649-3-36-1.3.3). For extended SI/TA consideration the operator shall provide the
Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining with the following:

1. Reasons for SI/TA of the well (R649-3-36-1.1).

2. The length of time the well is expected to be SI/TA (R649-3-36-1.2), and

3. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well has
integrity, meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition, static fluid level,
pressure, existence or absence of Underground Sources of Drinking Water and
other factors do not make the well a risk to public health and safety or the
environment (R649-3-36-1.3).

Please note that the Divisions preferred method for showing well integrity is by MIT.

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, POBox 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114 -5801

telephone (801) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (80 l) 538-7458 • www ogm.utah.gOV OIL, GAS &



Page 2
EOG Resources, Inc.
March 2, 2011

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity and may help
qualify your well for extended SI/TA. Note: As of July 1, 2003, wells in violation of the SIITA
rule R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-1-4.2, 4.3).

1. Wellbore diagram, and
2. Copy of recent casing pressure test, and
3. Current pressures on the wellbore (tubing pressure, casing pressure, and

casing/casing annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity, and
4. Fluid level in the wellbore, and
5. An explanation of how the submitted information proves integrity.

If the required information is not received within 30 days of the date of this notice, further
actions may be initiated. If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me at
(801) 538-5281.

S y,

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

DKD/JP/js
Enclosure
ec: Compliance File

Well File
LaVonne Garrison, SITLA

N:\O&G Reviewed



ATTACHMENT A

Well Name API LEASE Years inactive
1 PETES WASH32-2 43-013-32453 ML-47068 1 Year 11 Months
2 CWU 486-2F 43-047-32949 ML-3077 1 Year 3 Months
3 STATE 1-32 43-047-35839 ML-48380 1 Year 5



State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER

GARY R. HERBERT Executive Director

covernor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GREGORY S. BELL JOHN R.BAZA
Lieutenant Govemor Division Director

January 26, 2012

CERTIFIED MAIL NO.: 7011 0110 0001 3568 1779

Ms. Kaylene Gardner
EOG Resources, Inc.
1060 East Highway 40
Vernal, UT 84078 i ( S Ib L

Subject: Second Notice: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned Well Requirements
for Fee or State Leases

Dear Ms. Gardner:

As of January 2012, EOG Resources, Inc. (EOG) has three (3) State Lease Wells (see
attachment A) that are currently in non-compliance with the requirements for extended shut-in or
temporarily abandoned (SI/TA) status.

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (Division) wishes to inform EOG that these
wells already had notices sent out March, 2011. The Division has not received any
correspondence from EOG concerning these matters nor seen indication of effort being made to
move these wells out of non-compliance status.

Wells SI/TA beyond twelve (12) consecutive months requires filing a Sundry Notice
(R649-3-36-1). Wells with five (5) years non-activity or non-productivity shall be plugged,
unless the Division grants approval for extended shut-in time upon a showing of good cause by
the operator (649-3-36-1.3.3). For extended SI/TA consideration the operator shall provide the
Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining with the following:

1. Reasons for SI/TA of the well (R649-3-36-1.1).
2. The length of time the well is expected to be SI/TA (R649-3-36-1.2), and
3. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well has

integrity, meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition, static fluid level,
pressure, existence or absence of Underground Sources of Drinking Water and
other factors do not make the well a risk to public health and safety or the
environment (R649-3-36-1.3).

Please note that the Divisions preferred method for showing well integrity is by MIT.
UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114 -5801

telephone (801) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • wwwogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS &



Page 2
EOG Resources, Inc.
January 26, 2012

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity and may help
qualify your well for extended SI/TA. Note: As of July 1, 2003, wells in violation of the SIITA
rule R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-1-4.2, 4.3).

1. Wellbore diagram, and
2. Copy of recent casing pressure test, and
3. Current pressures on the wellbore (tubing pressure, casing pressure, and

casing/casing annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity, and
4. Fluid level in the wellbore, and
5. An explanation of how the submitted information proves integrity.

If the required information is not received within 30 days of the date of this notice, further
actions may be initiated. If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me at
(801) 538-5281.

incer

' i Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

DKD/JP/js
Enclosure
cc: Compliance File

Well File
LaVonne Garrison, SITLA

N:\O&G Reviewed



ATTACHMENT A

Well Name API LEASE Years inactive

1 PETES WASH 32-2 43-013-32453 ML-47068 2 Years 11 Months
2 CWU 486-2F 43-047-32949 ML-3077 2 Years 3 Months

3 STATE 1-32 43-047-35839 ML-48380 2 Years 5



RECEIVED: Apr. 11, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTSTML-47068 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 PETES WASH 32-2 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43013324530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 PETES WASH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2049 FNL 1959 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWNE Section: 02 Township: 11.0S Range: 16.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

4 /11 /2012

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests to Plug and Abandon the
referenced well as per the attached procedure. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145

TITLE
 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 4 /11 /2012

May 08, 2012

Sundry Number: 24754 API Well Number: 43013324530000Sundry Number: 24754 API Well Number: 43013324530000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTSTML-47068

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well PETES WASH 32-2

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources, Inc. 43013324530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111 Ext PETESWASH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

2049 FNL 1959 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWNE Section: 02 Township: 11.0S Range: 16.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

4/11/2012
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENTREPORT DEEPEN FRACTURETREAT NEWCONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests to Plug and Abandon the Approved by the
referenced well as per the attached procedure. Utah Division of

OFI, Gas and Mining

Date: May 08, 2012

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 4/11/2012

RECEIVED: Apr. 11,



RECEIVED: May. 08, 2012

  

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43013324530000

1. Notify the Division at least 24 hours prior to conducting abandonment operations. Please call
Dan Jarvis at 801-538-5338. 

2. Amend Plug #1: A 10 sx plug (±100’) shall be spotted on top of the CIBP @ 10750, not 5 sx as
proposed. 

3. Amend Plug #2: This plug shall be an inside/outside plug. RIH and perforate @ 4850’. Establish
circulation down the 4 ½” casing back up the 4 ½” x 9 5/8” annulus. If injection into the perfs
cannot be established a 200’ plug (±16 sx) shall be balanced from ±5050’ 4850’. If injection is

established: RIH with CICR and set at 4950’. M&P 68 sx cement, sting into CICR pump 56 sx,
sting out and dump 12 sx on top of CICR. This will isolate the base of the Moderately Saline

Groundwater as required by rule R649-3-24-3.3 and top of the Wasatch formation. 

4. Amend Plug #3: This plug shall be an inside/outside plug. RIH and perforate @ 1750’. Establish
circulation down the 4 ½” casing back up the 4 ½” x 9 5/8” annulus. If injection into the perfs

cannot be established a 200’ plug (±16 sx) shall be balanced from ±1800’ to 1600’. If injection is
established: RIH with CICR and set at 1700’. M&P 53 sx cement, sting into CICR pump 45sx, sting

out and dump 8 sx on top of CICR. This will isolate the top of the Green River formation. 

5. All balanced plugs shall be tagged to ensure that they are at the depth specified. 

6. All annuli shall be cemented from a minimum depth of 100’ to the surface. 

7. Surface reclamation shall be done in accordance with R649-3-34 – Well Site Restoration. 

8. All requirements in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-24 shall apply. 

9. If there are any changes to the procedure or the wellbore configuration, notify Dustin Doucet
at 801-538-5281 (ofc) or 801-733-0983 (home) prior to continuing with the procedure. 

10. All other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation General
Rules shall apply. 

Sundry Number: 24754 API Well Number: 43013324530000Sundry Number: 24754 API Well Number: 43013324530000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources
Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

TI, BA% Pr NINTfdG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43013324530000

1. Notify the Division at least 24 hours prior to conducting abandonment operations. Please call
Dan Jarvis at 801-538-5338.

2. Amend Plug #1: A 10 sx plug (±100') shall be spotted on top of the CIBP @ 10750, not 5 sx as
proposed.

3. Amend Plug #2: This plug shall be an insideloutside plug. RIH and perforate @ 4850'. Establish
circulation down the 4 ½" casing back up the 4 ½" x 9 5/8" annulus. If injection into the perfs
cannot be established a 200' plug (±16 sx) shall be balanced from ±5050' 4850'. If injection is

established: RIH with CICR and set at 4950'. M&P 68 sx cement, sting into CICR pump 56 sx,
sting out and dump 12 sx on top of CICR. This will isolate the base of the Moderately Saline

Groundwater as required by rule R649-3-24-3.3 and top of the Wasatch formation.

4. Amend Plug #3: This plug shall be an insideloutside plug. RIH and perforate @ 1750'. Establish
circulation down the 4 ½" casing back up the 4 ½" x 9 5/8" annulus. If injection into the perfs

cannot be established a 200' plug (±16 sx) shall be balanced from ±1800' to 1600'. If injection is
established: RIH with CICR and set at 1700'. M&P 53 sx cement, sting into CICR pump 45sx, sting

out and dump 8 sx on top of CICR. This will isolate the top of the Green River formation.

5. AII balanced plugs shall be tagged to ensure that they are at the depth specified.

6. AII annuli shall be cemented from a minimum depth of 100' to the surface.

7. Surface reclamation shall be done in accordance with R649-3-34 - Well Site Restoration.

8. AII requirements in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-24 shall apply.

9. If there are any changes to the procedure or the wellbore configuration, notify Dustin Doucet
at 801-538-5281 (ofc) or 801-733-0983 (home) prior to continuing with the procedure.

10. AII other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation General
Rules shall apply.

RECEIVED: May. 08,



RECEIVED: May. 08, 2012

Sundry Number: 24754 API Well Number: 43013324530000Sundry Number: 24754 API Well Number: 43013324530000

"U Wellbore Diagram r263

API Well No: 43-013-32453-00-00 Permit No: Well Name/No: PETES WASH 32-2

Company Name: EOG RESOURCES, INC.

Location: See: 2 T: 11S R: 16E Spot: SWNE String Information
Coordinates: X: 577868 Y: 4415680 Bottom Diameter Weight Length

String (ft sub) (inches) (lb/ft) (ft)Field Name: PETES WASH
HOL1 318 17.5

County Name: DUCHESNE SURF 318 13.375 48 318
HOL2 3997 12.25
11 3997 9.625 40 3997
llOL3 13090 7.875

Cement from 318 ft to surfac

Surface: 13.375 in. @318 Ily /UX uss>PROD 13090 4.5 11.6 13090

. §i Tl 12537 2.375
lole: 17.5 in. @318 ft. ou -

Cement fr i 997 ft ' ement Information

Intermediate: 9.625 97 BOC TOC
tug (ft sub) (ft sub) Class Sacks

Hole: 12.25 in. @3997 ft 3997 UK 530

PROD 13090 8900 UK 1095
SURF 318 0 UK 267

,f-
,

S Perforation Information

.id)(
6 Top Bottom

.</)(3.34

194b0 12f ub) Shts/Ft No Shts Dt Squeeze

fus)(it4s) 10811 11566

oá5b FormationInformation
OŸ lo Formation DepthgvfL,O -

e
o rt

SAW
000

[00/ ,ty .

WSTC 4890
NHORN 7250Cement f¡om 13090 ft to 8900 ft(f ST.f. MVRD 9412

Tubin .375 in. @12537 ft PRRV 10466
Production: 4.5 in. @13090 ft SEGO 11601

Hole: 7.875 in. @ 13090 ft. CSLGT 11694

T :: 13100 TVD: 13100 PBTD: 13049

Page



RECEIVED: Apr. 11, 2012

Sundry Number: 24754 API Well Number: 43013324530000Sundry Number: 24754 API Well Number: 43013324530000

PLUG & ABANDON PROGRAM

Pete's Wash 32-2 March 13, 2012
2049' FNL & 1959' FEL (SWINE) EOG WI: 50.0000%
Section 2, T11S, R16E NRI: 41.750000%
Duchesne County, Utah API# 43-013-32453

AFE# 313107

WELL DATA:

ELEVATION: 6527' GL KB: 6541' (14'KB)

TOTAL DEPTH: 13100' PBTD: 13049'

CASING: 13-3/8", 48#, H-40 set @ 318' KB. Cemented w/267 sxs Class 'G'.
9-5/8", 40#, J-55 set @ 3997' KB. Cemented w/315 sxs Hi-Lift 'G',
followed by 215 sxs RFC .

4 ½", 11.6#, P-110 set @ 13090' KB. Cemented w/570 sxs 35/65 Pozmix,
followed by 525 sxs 50/50 Pozmix.

TUBING: 2-3/8", 4.7#, N-80 landed @ 10880' KB

PERFORATIONS: 10811'-12498'

PROCEDURE:

1. MIRU SU. ND wellhead. NU BOPE. POH with tubing.

2. PU 3 7/8" bit and 4 ½" scraper. RIH to 10775'. POH and lay down tools.

3. PU CIBP. RIH to 10750'. Set CIBP at 10750'+/-. RU cement company. Spot 5 sxs of class
"G" w/2% CaCl2 on top of CIBP. PUH filling the casing with 9 ppg brine to 5000'.

4. RU cement company. Spot 15 sxs of class "G" w/2%CaCl2cement plug from 4800' to 5000',
100' above the Wasatch formation top.

5. PUH filling casing with 9 ppg brine to 1750'.

6. RU cement company. Spot 40 sxs of class "G" w/2% CaCl2 cement plug from 1200' to 1750',
100' above Base of Usable Water (1300') and Green River (1650') formation tops.

7. PUH filling casing with 9 ppg brine to 375'.



RECEIVED: Apr. 11, 2012

Sundry Number: 24754 API Well Number: 43013324530000Sundry Number: 24754 API Well Number: 43013324530000

8. RUWL. Shoot four squeeze holes at 375' using a 3 1/8" HSC ported gun, 12 gram charges, 90
degree phase. RDWL.

9. Pump down the 4 ½" casing trying to establish circulation from 375' up the 4 ½" X 9 5/8" casing
annulus.

10. Pump 160 sxs of Class "G" w/ 2% CaCl2 down the 4 ½" casing. Should circulate out 6 bbls of
cement, leaving 4 ½" casing full. If necessary do a top off job.

11. Cut of casing head. Weld on marker plate ± 3' below ground level. Remove anchors and
backfill over the marker.

PREPARED BY:
J.H. Kennah, Production Engineering Advisor

APPROVED BY:
Ted Kelly, Operations



RECEIVED: Apr. 11, 2012

Sundry Number: 24754 API Well Number: 43013324530000Sundry Number: 24754 API Well Number: 43013324530000

WELLBORE DIAGRAM

Operator: EOG Resources, Inc.
Field Name: Stone Cabin
Well Name: Pete's Wash 32-2

Location: 2049' FNL & 1959' FEL (SW NE) Sec. 2-T11S-R16E
County: Duchesne

API #: 4301332453
Date: 11/30/06

GL: 6527'

KB: 6541'

) Spud Date: 11/17/03

) ~ Completion Date: 3/11/04

) Surface Casing: 13-3/8", 48#, H-40 @ 318'
) w/267 ax Class G cmt

( ) Original Completion:
( ) Formation: Perforations: Treatment:

( ) Blackhawk 11,940'-942', 11,964'-965', 4,953 gals YF-125 fluid
( ) 11,982'-983', 12,003'-004', followed by 41,908 gais YF-118 & YF-125 fluid
( ) 12,011'-013', 12,037'-039', w/163,721# 20/40 sand down csg

12,052'-053' (3 SPF)

MPR ( )
( ) Sunnyside 12,208'-209', 12,227'-228', 5,000 gals YF-125 fluid
( ) 12,234'-235', 12,242'-243', followed by 67,662 gals YF-120 & YF-125 fluid
( ) 12,268'-269', 12,274'-275', w/232,100# 20/40 sand down csq
( ) 12,291'-292', 12,298'-299',

12,330'-331' (3 SPF)
MPR

( ) Kenilworth 12,423'-424', 12,435'-437', 5,000 gais YF-125 fluid
( ) 12,470'-471', 12,475'-476', followed by 48,216 gals YF-120 & YF-125 fluid
( ) 12,482'-483', 12,490'-491' w/168,497# 20/40 sand down cag
( ) 12,497'-498' (3 SPF)

LPR Recompletion (8/04):

) Formation: Perforations: Treatment:

( ) MPR 10,811'-812', 10,818'-819', 7,560 gals YF-125 fluid
( ) 10,824'-825', 10,828'-829', followed by 44,814 gals YF-118 & YF-125 fluid
( ) 10,855'-857', 10,880'-881', wf146,300# 20/40 sand down csq
( ) 10,888'-889', 10,897'-898', Screened out

) 10,903'-904',
) 10,931'-932' (2 SPF)

LPR

( ) MPR 10,973'-976', 10,996'-998', 5,000 gals YF-125 fluid
( ) 11,052'-054', 11,077'-079', followed by 41,580 gals YF-118 & YF-125 fluid
( ) 11,197'-200' (2 SPF) w/144,180# 20/40 sand down csg

Screened out
Blackhawk (

( ) LPR 11,313'-315', 11,325'-328', 5,000 gals YF-125 fluid
( ) 11,365'-367', followed by 36,288 gals YF-118 & YF-125 fluid

11,404'-406' (3 SPF) w/131,250#20/40 sand down csg
Sunnyside ( )

( ) LPR 11,470'-473', 11,506'-508', 5,000 gals YF-125 fluid
( ) 11,555'-557', 11,564'-566', followed by 42,420 gals YF-118 & YF-125 fluid

) 11,616'-618' (2 SPF) w/168,720# 20/40 sand down csg
Kenilworth ( ) Commingled all perfs (8/04)

) DST's & Cores: Sidewall cores

( ) Tubing: 2-3/8", 4.7#, N-80 @ 10,880'

( ) Packer:

( ) PBTD: 13,049'

( ) Intermediate Casing: 9-5/8", 40#, J-55 @ 3997'
( ) w/315 sx Hi-Lift cmt followed by
( ) 215 sx RFC cmt

( ) Production Casing: 4-1/2", 11.6#, P-110 @ 13,090'
( ) w/570 sx 35-65 Pozmix cmt followed by
( ) 525 sx 50-50 Pozmix cmt

( ) TD:



RECEIVED: Dec. 13, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTSTML-47068 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 PETES WASH 32-2 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43013324530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 PETES WASH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2049 FNL 1959 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWNE Section: 02 Township: 11.0S Range: 16.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

11/29 /2012

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 EOG Resources, Inc. Plugged and Abandoned the referenced well on
11/29/2012. Please see the attached well chronology report. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145

TITLE
 Lead Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 12/13/2012

December 17, 2012

Sundry Number: 33080 API Well Number: 43013324530000Sundry Number: 33080 API Well Number: 43013324530000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTSTML-47068

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well PETES WASH 32-2

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources, Inc. 43013324530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111 Ext PETESWASH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

2049 FNL 1959 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWNE Section: 02 Township: 11.0S Range: 16.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

11/29/2012
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EOG Resources, Inc. Plugged and Abandoned the referenced well on Accepted by the
11/29/2012. Please see the attached well chronology report. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
December 17, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145 Lead Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 12/13/2012

RECEIVED: Dec. 13,



RECEIVED: Dec. 13, 2012

Well Name: PETES  32−02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : LPR,MPR PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 10811−12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SWABBING

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 17:00 11.0 0 0 SICP 300 PSIG. RU TO SWAB. IFL @ 6100’. MADE 23 RUNS. RECOVERED 135 BF. CP 600 PSIG.
EQUALIZED TBG AND CSG. SI. SDFN.

11−23−2006 Reported By POWELL                          

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $8,437 Daily Total $8,437

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,479,153 Completion $1,305,198 Well Total $2,784,351

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : LPR,MPR PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 10811−12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RDMOSU− RETURN TO SALES

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

07:00 15:00 8.0 0 0 SICP 1200 PSIG. RU TO SWAB. IFL @ 6700’. MADE 4 RUNS & WELL STARTED FLOWING. FLOWED
1 HR TO CLEAN UP. SI. PREP TO RETURN TO SALES.

Event No 4.0 Description PETE’S WASH 32−02 −− P&A. 

Operator EOG RESOURCES, INC WI % 50.0 NRI % 41.75

AFE No 313107 AFE Total 50,800 DHC / CWC 0/ 50,800

Rig Contr POWELL SER.
INC

Rig Name RIG 1 Start Date 11−21−2012 Release Date 11−29−2012

11−01−2012 Reported By ALI ARDINGTON          

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,479,153 Completion $1,305,198 Well Total $2,784,351

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : LPR,MPR PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 10811−12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: EVENT 4 − P&A

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 EVENT 4 − P&A

11−21−2012 Reported By GORDON BASTIAN         

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $8,720 Daily Total $8,720

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,479,153 Completion $1,313,918 Well Total $2,793,071

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : LPR,MPR PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 10811−12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time:  FLOW WELL 

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 SITP 3900 PSI, SICP 5000 + PSI, OPEN WELL @ 9: AM ,24/64 CHOKE, @ 3: PM INSTALL 32/64
CHOKE.  20 HR’S RECOVERED 546 BW, AVG. 27 BPH,  OPEN CSG.UP @ 3:AM @ 5: AM 300 PSI ON
TBG & CSG.  AVG. 6 BPH.

11−22−2012 Reported By GORDON BASTIAN         

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $10,245 Daily Total $10,245

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,479,153 Completion $1,324,163 Well Total $2,803,316

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Page 56

Sundry Number: 33080 API Well Number: 43013324530000Sundry Number: 33080 API Well Number: 43013324530000
Well Name: PETES 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : LPR,MPR PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 10811-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SWABBING

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 17:00 11.0 0 0 SICP 300 PSIG. RU TO SWAB. IFL @6100'. MADE 23 RUNS. RECOVERED 135 BF. CP 600 PSIG.
EQUALIZED TBGAND CSG. SI. SDFN.

11-23-2006 Reported By POWELL

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $8,437 Daily Total $8,437

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,479,153 Completion $1,305,198 Well Total $2,784,351

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : LPR,MPR PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 10811-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RDMOSU- RETURN TO SALES

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

07:00 15:00 8.0 0 0 SICP 1200 PSIG. RU TO SWAB. IFL @6700'. MADE 4 RUNS & WELL STARTED FLOWING. FLOWED
1 HR TO CLEAN UP. SI. PREP TO RETURN TO SALES.

Event No 4.0 Description PETE'S WASH 32-02 -- P&A.

Operator EOG RESOURCES, INC WI % 50.0 NRI % 41.75

AFE No 313107 AFE Total 50,800 DHC / CWC 0/ 50,800

Rig Contr POWELL SER. Rig Name RIG 1 Start Date 11-21-2012 Release Date 11-29-2012

INC

11-01-2012 Reported By ALIARDINGTON

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,479,153 Completion $1,305,198 Well Total $2,784,351

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : LPR,MPR PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 10811-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: EVENT 4 - P&A

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 EVENT 4 - P&A

11-21-2012 Reported By GORDON BASTIAN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $8,720 Daily Total $8,720

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,479,153 Completion $1,313,918 Well Total $2,793,071

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : LPR,MPR PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 10811-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW WELL

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 SITP 3900 PSI, SICP 5000 + PSI, OPEN WELL @9: AM ,24/64 CHOKE, @3: PM INSTALL 32/64
CHOKE. 20 HR'S RECOVERED 546 BW, AVG. 27 BPH, OPEN CSG.UP @3:AM @5: AM 300 PSI ON
TBG & CSG. AVG. 6 BPH.

11-22-2012 Reported By GORDON BASTIAN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $10,245 Daily Total $10,245

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,479,153 Completion $1,324,163 Well Total $2,803,316

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
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Well Name: PETES  32−02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

Formation : LPR,MPR PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 10811−12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MIRU SER. RIG

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 FTP & FCP 250 PSI. MIRU POWELL SER. RIG 1. TOP KILLED TBG W/ 45 BW, CSG W/ 55 BW. ND
TREE, NU BOP. POOH W/ 120 JTS 2−3/8’’  EOT @ 6930’ +/− SDFWE

11−27−2012 Reported By HOOLEY     

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $8,125 Daily Total $8,125

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,479,153 Completion $1,332,288 Well Total $2,811,441

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : LPR,MPR PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 10811−12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: P&A

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 17:00 11.0 0 0 SITP 3800 PSIG. SICP 4000 PSIG. BLEW DN AND KILLED TBG W/45 BFW. POH. WELL FLOWING.
UNABLE TO KILL. FLOWED 1 HR. KILLED W/70 BFW. RIH W/BIT AND SCRAPER TO 10,786’. POH
TO 6900’. SDFN.

11−28−2012 Reported By HOOLEY     

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $10,200 Daily Total $10,200

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,479,153 Completion $1,342,488 Well Total $2,821,641

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : LPR,MPR PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 10811−12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: P&A

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 18:30 12.5 0 0 SITP 0 PSIG (TBG FLOAT). SICP 2400 PSIG. BLEW CSG DN. POH W/BIT AND SCRAPER. RIH
W/CICR AND SET @ 10,752’. RU HALLIBURTON CEMENTERS. CIRCULATED W/FW. PUMPED 15
SXS CLASS ’G’ CEMENT W/4−HR RETARDER. SPOTTED CEMENT ON TOP OF CICR (194’). POH
ABOVE CEMENT. REVERSE CIRCULATED CLEAN. RD HALLIBURTON. SPOTTED 85 BBLS 9#
BRINE WTR TO 5100’. POH TO 5900’. SDFN. 

11−29−2012 Reported By HOOLEY     

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $9,030 Daily Total $9,030

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,479,153 Completion $1,351,518 Well Total $2,830,671

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : LPR,MPR PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 10811−12498 − PLUGGED PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: P&A

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 0 0 SITP & SICP 0 PSIG. POH, LD EXCESS TBG. RU CUTTERS WL. SHOT 4 SQUEEZE HOLES AT
4863’−64’. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON. ESTABLISHED INJECTION RATE OF 4 BPM/500 PSIG. RD
HALLIBURTON. RIH W/CICR. SET @ 4815’. RU HALLIBURTON. CONFIRMED INJECTION BELOW
CICR. PUMPED 68 SXS CLASS ’G’ CEMENT W/2% CaCl. DISPLACED AND SQUEEZED 56 SXS
BELOW CICR W/52 SXS INTO PERFS. STUNG OUT OF CICR AND SPOTTED 12 SXS ON TOP OF
CICR (154’). PULLED OUT OF CEMENT AND REVERSED CLEAN. PUMPED 45 BBLS 9# BRINE.
POH, LD EXCESS TBG. RUWL. SHOT 4 SQUEEZE HOLES AT 1744’. RDWL. RIH W/CICR. SET @
1694’. RU HALLIBURTON. PUMPED 55 SXS CLASS ’G’ CEMENT W/2% CaCl. DISPLACED AND
SQUEEZED 45 SXS BELOW CICR W/42 SXS INTO PERFS (FLUID RETURNS TO SURFACE UP
SURFACE CSG). STUNG OUT AND SPOTTED 10 SXS ON TOP OF CICR (128’). PULLED OUT OF
CEMENT AND REVERSED CLEAN. RD HALLIBURTON. PUMPED 20 BBLS 9# BRINE. POH, LD ALL
TBG. SDFN. 

11−30−2012 Reported By HOOLEY     

Page 57

Sundry Number: 33080 API Well Number: 43013324530000Sundry Number: 33080 API Well Number: 43013324530000
Well Name: PETES 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

Formation : LPR,MPR PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 10811-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MIRU SER. RIG

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 FTP & FCP 250 PSI. MIRU POWELL SER. RIG 1. TOP KILLED TBG W/ 45 BW, CSG W/ 55 BW. ND
TREE, NU BOP. POOH W/ 120 JTS 2-3/8" EOT @6930'+/- SDFWE

11-27-2012 Reported By HOOLEY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $8,125 Daily Total $8,125

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,479,153 Completion $1,332,288 Well Total $2,811,441

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : LPR,MPR PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 10811-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: P&A

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 17:00 11.0 0 0 SITP 3800 PSIG. SICP 4000 PSIG. BLEW DN AND KILLED TBG W/45 BFW. POH. WELL FLOWING.
UNABLE TO KILL. FLOWED 1 HR. KILLED W/70 BFW. RIH W/BIT AND SCRAPER TO 10,786'. POH
TO 6900'. SDFN.

11-28-2012 Reported By HOOLEY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $10,200 Daily Total $10,200

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,479,153 Completion $1,342,488 Well Total $2,821,641

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : LPR,MPR PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 10811-12498 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: P&A

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 18:30 12.5 0 0 SITP 0 PSIG (TBG FLOAT). SICP 2400 PSIG. BLEW CSG DN. POH W/BIT AND SCRAPER. RIH
W/CICRAND SET @10,752'. RU HALLIBURTON CEMENTERS. CIRCULATED W/FW. PUMPED 15
SXS CLASS 'G' CEMENT W/4-HR RETARDER. SPOTTED CEMENT ON TOP OF CICR (194'). POH
ABOVE CEMENT. REVERSE CIRCULATED CLEAN. RD HALLIBURTON. SPOTTED 85 BBLS 9#
BRINE WTR TO 5100'. POH TO 5900'. SDFN.

11-29-2012 Reported By HOOLEY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $9,030 Daily Total $9,030

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,479,153 Completion $1,351,518 Well Total $2,830,671

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : LPR,MPR PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 10811-12498 - PLUGGED PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: P&A

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 0 0 SITP & SICP 0 PSIG. POH, LD EXCESS TBG. RU CUTTERS WL. SHOT 4 SQUEEZE HOLES AT
4863'-64'. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON. ESTABLISHED INJECTION RATE OF 4 BPM/500 PSIG. RD
HALLIBURTON. RIH W/CICR. SET @4815'. RU HALLIBURTON. CONFIRMED INJECTION BELOW
CICR. PUMPED 68 SXS CLASS 'G' CEMENT W/2% CaCl. DISPLACED AND SQUEEZED 56 SXS
BELOW CICR W/52 SXS INTO PERFS. STUNG OUT OF CICR AND SPOTTED 12 SXS ON TOP OF
CICR (154'). PULLED OUT OF CEMENT AND REVERSED CLEAN. PUMPED 45 BBLS 9# BRINE.
POH, LD EXCESS TBG. RUWL. SHOT 4 SQUEEZE HOLES AT 1744'. RDWL. RIH W/CICR. SET @
1694'. RU HALLIBURTON. PUMPED 55 SXS CLASS 'G' CEMENT W/2% CaCl. DISPLACED AND
SQUEEZED 45 SXS BELOW CICR W/42 SXS INTO PERFS (FLUID RETURNS TO SURFACE UP
SURFACE CSG). STUNG OUT AND SPOTTED 10 SXS ON TOP OF CICR (128'). PULLED OUT OF
CEMENT AND REVERSED CLEAN. RD HALLIBURTON. PUMPED 20 BBLS 9# BRINE. POH, LD ALL
TBG. SDFN.

11-30-2012 Reported By HOOLEY
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Well Name: PETES  32−02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $63,824 Daily Total $63,824

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,479,153 Completion $1,415,342 Well Total $2,894,495

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : LPR,MPR PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 10811−12498 − PLUGGED PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: P&A. PREP FOR LOCATION REHAB.

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 14:00 8.0 0 0 RU CUTTERS WL. SHOT 4 SQUEEZE HOLES AT 375’. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON. CIRCULATED
DOWN 4−1/2" CSG AND UP 9−5/8" SURFACE CSG W/ FULL RETURNS UNTIL CLEAN. PUMPED 203
SX CLASS ’G’ W/3% CaCl WITH FULL RETURNS AND GOOD CEMENT TO SURFACE (8 BBLS). RD
HALLIBURTON.  CUT OFF CSG AND INSTALLED MARKER PLATE. REMOVED RIG ANCHORS.
RDMOSU. 





STATE INSPECTOR APPROVED P&A. 
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Sundry Number: 33080 API Well Number: 43013324530000Sundry Number: 33080 API Well Number: 43013324530000
Well Name: PETES 32-02 Field: KENILWORTH Property: 053287

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $63,824 Daily Total $63,824

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,479,153 Completion $1,415,342 Well Total $2,894,495

MD 13,100 TVD 13,100 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : LPR,MPR PBTD : 13049.0 Perf : 10811-12498 - PLUGGED PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: P&A. PREP FOR LOCATION REHAB.

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 14:00 8.0 0 0 RU CUTTERS WL. SHOT 4 SQUEEZE HOLES AT 375'. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON. CIRCULATED
DOWN 4-1/2" CSG AND UP 9-5/8" SURFACE CSG W/ FULL RETURNS UNTIL CLEAN. PUMPED 203
SX CLASS 'G' W/3% CaCl WITH FULL RETURNS AND GOOD CEMENT TO SURFACE (8 BBLS). RD
HALLIBURTON. CUT OFF CSG AND INSTALLED MARKER PLATE. REMOVED RIG ANCHORS.
RDMOSU.

-

STATE INSPECTOR APPROVED P&A.
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RECEIVED: Nov. 26, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTSTML-47068 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 PETES WASH 32-2 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43013324530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 PETES WASH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2049 FNL 1959 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWNE Section: 02 Township: 11.0S Range: 16.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

11/26 /2012

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests permission to reclaim the
referenced location per the attached.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Michelle Robles 307 276-4842

TITLE
 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 11/26/2012

January 17, 2013

Sundry Number: 32358 API Well Number: 43013324530000Sundry Number: 32358 API Well Number: 43013324530000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTSTML-47068

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well PETES WASH 32-2

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources, Inc. 43013324530000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111 Ext PETESWASH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

2049 FNL 1959 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWNE Section: 02 Township: 11.0S Range: 16.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

11/26/2012
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENTREPORT DEEPEN FRACTURETREAT NEWCONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests permission to reclaim the Approved by the
referenced location per the attached. Utah Division of

OFI, Gas and Mining

Date: January 17, 2013

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Michelle Robles 307 276-4842 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 11/26/2012

RECEIVED: Nov. 26,
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Pete’s Wash 32-2 Reclamation Plan 
Section 2, T11S, R16E 
2049 FNL 1959 FEL 

43-013-32453 
 
This reclamation plan has been developed specifically for the Pete’s Wash 32-2 well pad and access 
road which is located within the SWNE Quarter of Section 2, T11S, R16E, Duchesne County, Utah.  
All reclamation activities will be conducted in accordance with EOG Resources, Inc.’s reclamation 
program and standards, the Utah State School Institutional Trust Land Administration Guidelines and 
Standards, and Utah Department of Oil, Gas, & Minerals (UDOGM) Rule 649-3-34 for Well Site 
Restoration. 
 
Site Preparation and Topography 
If present all trash and contaminated soil will be removed from the well site and access road prior to 
commencing reclamation activities. All gravel and surface aggregate that has been spread on the site 
will be stripped, buried, and then covered sufficiently with spoil to prevent surface exposure. Any 
existing erosion control features such as rip rap or water bars will be removed. The well pad will be 
re-contoured to the original contour or a profile that blends with the surrounding landform.  
 
Topsoil and Site Stabilization 
Topsoil that was previously spread out during interim reclamation will be stripped back prior to re-
contouring, and then all available topsoil will be evenly spread over the site. To reduce erosion 
potential, unstable soils and slopes will be stabilized through the use of fiber rolls, fiber blankets, rip 
rap, and mulch.  In areas that allow equipment operation straw and/or hay mulch will be applied with 
a mulch blower and then crimped. On slopes too steep for equipment and crimping a tackifier will be 
added to the mulch. Mulch will be spread at an application rate of approximately 1.5 tons/acre.    
 
Re-vegetation  
Drill seeding on the contour will be done on slopes that allow equipment and broadcast seeding will 
be done on slopes too steep for equipment. Seeding or planting will be repeated until re-vegetation is 
successful as determined by the Authorized Officer. The proposed seed mix is designed based on the 
reference site community and contains species designed to stabilize soils, restore production, and 
provide wildlife habitat. Based on site conditions the following seed mix is proposed:  
 
Common Name   Pounds Per Acre (PLS)  
Crested Wheatgrass   4  
Siberian Wheatgrass   4 
Bluebunch Wheatgrass   1  
Indian Ricegrass   1  
Needle and Thread grass  3 
Forage Kochia    2.5 
Fourwing Saltbrush   2 
Black sagebrush   3 
Scarlet globemallow or   1 
  Gooseberry leaf globemallow 
 

Sundry Number: 32358 API Well Number: 43013324530000Sundry Number: 32358 API Well Number: 43013324530000

Pete's Wash 32-2 Reclamation Plan
Section 2, T11S, R16E
2049 FNL 1959 FEL

43-013-32453

This reclamation plan has been developed specifically for the Pete's Wash 32-2 well pad and access
road which is located within the SWNE Quarterof Section 2, Tl lS, Rl6E, Duchesne County, Utah.
All reclamation activities will be conducted in accordance with EOG Resources, Inc.'s reclamation
program and standards, the Utah State School Institutional Trust Land Administration Guidelines and
Standards, and Utah Department of Oil, Gas, & Minerals (UDOGM) Rule 649-3-34 for Well Site
Restoration.

Site Preparation and Topography
If present all trash and contaminated soil will be removed from the well site and access road prior to
commencing reclamation activities. All gravel and surface aggregate that has been spread on the site
will be stripped, buried, and then covered sufficiently with spoil to prevent surface exposure. Any
existing erosion control features such as rip rap or water bars will be removed. The well pad will be
re-contoured to the original contour or a profile that blends with the surrounding landform.

Topsoil and Site Stabilization
Topsoil that was previously spread out during interim reclamation will be stripped back prior to re-
contouring, and then all available topsoil will be evenly spread over the site. To reduce erosion
potential, unstable soils and slopes will be stabilized through the use of fiber rolls, fiber blankets, rip
rap, and mulch. In areas that allow equipment operation straw and/or hay mulch will be applied with
a mulch blower and then crimped. On slopes too steep for equipment and crimping a tackifier will be
added to the mulch. Mulch will be spread at an application rate of approximately 1.5 tons/acre.

Re-vegetation
Drill seeding on the contour will be done on slopes that allow equipment and broadcast seeding will
be done on slopes too steep for equipment. Seeding or planting will be repeated until re-vegetation is
successful as determined by the Authorized Officer. The proposed seed mix is designed based on the
reference site community and contains species designed to stabilize soils, restore production, and
provide wildlife habitat. Based on site conditions the following seed mix is proposed:

Common Name Pounds Per Acre (PLS)
Crested Wheatgrass 4
Siberian Wheatgrass 4
Bluebunch Wheatgrass l
Indian Ricegrass l
Needle and Thread grass 3
Forage Kochia 2.5
Fourwing Saltbrush 2
Black sagebrush 3
Scarlet globemallow or 1

Gooseberry leaf globemallow

RECEIVED: Nov. 26,



RECEIVED: Nov. 26, 2012

Seed application rate will be doubled for broadcast seeding; all broadcast seeding will be raked to 
cover the seed. Sagebrush will be broadcast seeded over snow. Barricades and/or fencing will be 
used to prevent access during the initial re-vegetation process.  
 
Control of Undesirable Species  
Undesirable and noxious species will be controlled using the principles of an integrated weed 
management program and will be dictated by site evaluation and monitoring. The application of 
herbicides will be done by a certified applicator. An herbicide will be used to control noxious weeds 
and other undesirable species. Spraying of herbicide will begin in late spring when target weeds are 
large enough to be effectively killed and/or seed production stymied. Following herbicide 
application, sites will be monitored for efficacy of application and additional controls implemented 
as site conditions necessitate.  
 
Monitoring  
Monitoring will be implemented to assess reclamation activities and ensure restoration advances 
toward the goal of final abandonment. Monitoring data will be used to assess compliance with 
reclamation goals as stated within this reclamation plan as well as the Utah State School Institutional 
Trust Land Administration Guidelines and Standards. In the event monitoring data indicates the site 
is not trending toward reclamation goals, or indicates poor vegetation, re-seeding will be repeated 
until a satisfactory stand has been obtained as determined by the Authorized Officer.  

Sundry Number: 32358 API Well Number: 43013324530000Sundry Number: 32358 API Well Number: 43013324530000

Seed application rate will be doubled for broadcast seeding; all broadcast seeding will be raked to
cover the seed. Sagebrush will be broadcast seeded over snow. Barricades and/or fencing will be
used to prevent access during the initial re-vegetation process.

Control of Undesirable Species
Undesirable and noxious species will be controlled using the principles of an integrated weed
management program and will be dictated by site evaluation and monitoring. The application of
herbicides will be done by a certified applicator. An herbicide will be used to control noxious weeds
and other undesirable species. Spraying of herbicide will begin in late spring when target weeds are
large enough to be effectively killed and/or seed production stymied. Following herbicide
application, sites will be monitored for efficacy of application and additional controls implemented
as site conditions necessitate.

Monitoring
Monitoring will be implemented to assess reclamation activities and ensure restoration advances
toward the goal of final abandonment. Monitoring data will be used to assess compliance with
reclamation goals as stated within this reclamation plan as well as the Utah State School Institutional
Trust Land Administration Guidelines and Standards. In the event monitoring data indicates the site
is not trending toward reclamation goals, or indicates poor vegetation, re-seeding will be repeated
until a satisfactory stand has been obtained as determined by the Authorized Officer.

RECEIVED: Nov. 26,
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