For‘m 3160-3 SUBMIT IN \PLICATE® Form approved.

c={Movember . (Other inst"@P%tons on Budget Bureau No. 1004-01 30
ororty 3-3310) UNITED STATES P everse side) Expires Augoct 31, tags O
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. LEASE DEBIGNATION aND BERIAL NG,
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 14-20~H62-1704

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL, DEEPEN, OR PLUG BACK O 17 INDIAR, ALLOTTER OR TRIBE NAMT
Ute Indjan Tribe

la. TYPE OF WORK .

DRILL (X DEEPEN [] PLUG BACK [ 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAMZ
b. TYPE OF WELL . N/A
g":x,x. | X a’;’LL OTHER :(l:;(::“ :(YNL: IPLE §. FARM OB LEASE NAME

2. NAME OF OPLRATOR Ute TY\-i ba'l
Bow Valley Petroleum, Inc. 178, WELL No.

3. ADDEEBS OF OPERATOR 2-3472
P.0. Drawer 130, Rooseyelt, Utah 84066 §§‘ | | T0. Fizco aND POOL, OR WiLDCAT
4, nc';?;?ur«c:r wELL (Report location clearly and In accordance with any State equjewts“ )7 1.- oy \S%g n B;Ilgefea] L/li\;iifxt(:h
1957' FWL, 1223' FSL, SE/SW r‘:‘r:“;g\z:j " AND SURVEY OB ABES
At proposed prod. zone D!VEQE&E“‘,;'“ ALe . i
same on s vOF - reSec.34, TIN, R2W, USB&M
147 DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FEOM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE® e ”";;_‘,',.ﬁ’ 12, COUNTY OB PARISH| 13. BTATE
3.5 miles due west of Neola - :
10. DISTANCE FROM PROPUSED® 12231 16. NO. OF ACBES IN LEABE . | 17. NO, OF ACRES ABSIGNED
LOCATION TO NEAREST uE, ~.| . ‘70 THIS WELL
PRO L o
(il:,:nt’{)yu%l;re‘:?sdlrllg‘l unlt Hne. if any) 640 640
18. DISTANCE ¥ROM PROFOSED LOCATION® 19. PROPOSED DEPTH 20. ROTARY OR CABLE TOOLS
‘E WELL, NG, COMPLETED,
oK APPLIED TON, oN Tmis LaAsk, rr. o 2420.53" 16,600" Rotary
21. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 22. APPROX. DATE WOBE WILL START®
5922' KB (est. ungraded G.L.) _ 6/86
23. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE 81ZE OF CABING WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH QUANTITY OF CEMENT
30" 20" 52.73¢# 40" 175 sx{to_surface)
12-1/4" 9-5/8" 40.004# 3000" 900 sx(to surface)
8-3/4" 7" 26-32# 14200" 1500 sx(to surface)
6" 5" 18# 16000' 700 sx(to top of Tiner)..,

This is a test of the Tertiary Wasatch Formation. Both the Wasatch and

Green] River will be comingled in time. Minimum 3000 psi BOPE will be

installed and pressure tested to 3000 psi prior to drilling the surface 0 %aps
casing show at 3000'. APR 28 1883

Minimum 5000 psi BOPD will be installed and tested to 5000 psi prior to
dr11]1ng the intermediate casing shoe at 14,200'. After dr1111ng the shoe,
the ;as1ng will be tested to and EMJ of 14.5 phg.

IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM : If proposal is to deepen or plug back, give data on present productive zone and proposed new productive
zone. If proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give pertinent data on subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths. Give blowout

preventer program, if any.

24,
@M\@W‘/r‘l\)%ﬂ/ TITLE Sr.District Enaineer DATE 4-27-86
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(This space for Federal or State office use)

PERMIT NO. APPBOVAL DATE

N @O?\/‘%@\ e D (st ///’A?M w6 /g ke

! CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY !

~ NDTICE OF APPROVAL | SURBTING OF APPROVAL ATTACHES
Ut cs0-6M- 50 *See Instructions On Reverse Side T2 S/TRATUR'S COPY

B he u«,aa»(/
Title 18 U.S.CYSection 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the
United States any false. fxctmous or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
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IN REPLY REFER TO:

United States Department of the Interior 4 |
BUREAU OF INDIAN AFFAIRS :7 ¢ﬂ%y129
UINTAH AND OURAY AGENCY - “M,b‘
Fort Duchesne, Utah 84026 D
(801) 722-2406 Ext. Ny,

Minerals & Mining

0il & Gas

MEMORANDUM

10 District Manager, Bureau of Land Managment
FROM: Superintendent, Uintah and Ouray Agency

DIVISION OF
SUBJECT: Bow Valley Petroleum, Ute Tribal Well 2-347Z2 located OlL, GAS & MINING
in the SE1/45W1/4, Section 34, TIN, R2W

We (concur with or, recommend) approval of the Application for Permit to
Drill subject well.

Based on available information on May 13, 1986,’we have cleared the proposed
location in the following areas of environmental impact.

YES X NO___ Listed threatened or endangered species.

YES X NO__ Critical wildlife habitat.

YES X  NO___ Archaelogical or cultural resources.

YES _ NO__ Air quality aspects (to be used only if project is
in or adjacent to a Class I area of attainment).

YES NO Other (if necessary)

. e & (‘a’h(/f"rré#@"l
6~ T-56.Chungs o por, ff/i’ﬁré? LTAE
REMARKS:  Access road to be moved west,586=f&= Reroute existing pipef&%gjto

east of location. Well-turn location -488—degrees. Must obtain
Tribal water permit.

The necessary surface protection and rehabilitation requirements are as per
approved APD.

%M/L“::“

Supérintendent

BURFL -

z‘.»‘.ir:emés @”4’ L
T —— f »

Dia. titn. 7}




CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR NOTICE TO DRILL \

Company Bow Valley Petroleum, Inc. Well No. Ut Tr 2-34Z2
Location ~Sec. 34 TLN R2W Lease No. 14-20-H62-1704
Onsite Inspection Date May 2, 1986

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that
full compliance is made with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100),
. Onshore 0il and Gas Order No. 1, and the approved plan of operations. The
“operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontFactors. A copy
of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to insure
compliance.

A. DRILLING PROGRAM

1. Estimated Depth at Which 0il, Gas, Water, or Other Mineral Bearing
Zones are Expected to be Encountered:

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals (as described
- by BLM at onsite) encountered during drilling, will be recorded by
S - depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be
' tested to determine commercial potential.

Please notify Wayne Svejnoha of this office if any fresh water is
encountered. '

2. Pressure Control Equipment

BOP and choke manifold systems will be consistent with API RP 53,
Pressure tests will be conducted before drilling out from under all
7 casing strings which are set and cemented in place. Blowout
caigttie w0 e preventer controls will be installed prior to drilling the surface
' ’ casing plug and will remain in use until the well is completed or
abandoned. Preventers will be inspected and operated at least
daily to ensure good mechanical working order, and this inspection
recorded on the daily drilling report. Preventers will be pressure
tested before drilling casing cement plugs.

The District Office should be notified, with sufficient lead time,
in order to have a BLM representative on location during pressure
testing.

3. Casing Program and Auxiliary Equipment

"The District Office should be notified, with sufficient lead time,
in order to have a BLM representative on location while running all
casing strings and cementing.

DIVISION OF
OlL, GAS & MINING



5.

Mud Program and Circulating Medium

No chromate additives will be used in the mud system on Federal and
Indian lands without prior BIM approval to ensure adequate
protection of fresh water aquifers.

Coring, Logeging and Testing Program

»

Daily drilling and completion progress reports shall be submitted
to this office on a weekly basis.

Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well
Completion and Recompletion Report and Log" (Form 3160-4) will be

“submitted not later than 30 days after completion of- the well or

after completion of operations being performed, in accordance with
43 CFR 3164. Two copies of all logs, core descriptions, core anal-
yses, well-test data, geologic summaries, sample description, and
all other surveys or data obtained and compiled during the drill-
ing, workover, and/or completion operations, will be filed with
Form 3160-4. Samples (cuttings, fluids, and/or gases) will be
submitted when requested by the authorized officer (AO0).

Notifications of Operations

No location will be constructed or moved, no well will be plugged,
and no drilling or workover equipment will be removed from a well
to be placed in a suspended status without prior approval of the
AO. If operations are to be suspended, prior approval of the AQ
will be obtained and notification given before resumption of opera-
tions.

The spud date will be reported orally to the AO within 48 hours
after spudding. If the spudding occurs on a weekend or holiday,
the report will be submitted on the following regular work day.
The oral report will be followed up with a Sundry Notice.

In accordance with Onshore 0il and Gas Order No. 1, this well will

be reported on Form 3160-6 '"Monthly Report of Operations', starting
with the month in which operations commence and continue each month
until the well is physically plugged and abandoned. This report
will be filed, in duplicate, to the Vernal BLM District Office, 170
South 500 East, Vernal, Utah 84078.

Immediate Report: Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents, or
any other unusual occurrences shall be promptly reported in accord-
ance with the requirements of NTL-3A or its revision.

If a replacement rig is contemplated for completion operations, a
"Sundry Notice" (Form 3160-5) to that effect will be filed, for
prior approval of the AO, and all conditions of this approved plan
are applicable during all operations conducted with the replacement
rig.

Y JUN 111986

DIVISION OF
O, GAS & MINING



Should the well be successfully completed for production, the AO
will be notified when the well is placed in a producing status.
Such notification will be sent by telegram or other written commun-—
ication, not later than 5 days following the date on which the well
is placed on production.

Pursuant to NTL-2B, with the approval of a District Engineer,
produced water may be temporarily disposed of into unlined pits for
a period of up to 90 days. During the period so authorized, an
application for approval of the permanent disposal method, along
with the required water analysis and other information, must be
submitted to the District Engineer.

Pursuant to NTL-4A, lessees or operators are authorized to vent/
flare gas during initial well evaluation tests, not exceeding a
period of 30 days or the production of 50 MMCF of gas, whichever
occurs first. An application must be filed with the District En-—
gineer and approval received, for any venting/flaring of gas beyond
the initial 30 day or authorized test period.

A schematic facilities diagram as required by 43 CFR 3162.7-2,
3162.7-3, and 3162.7-4 shall be submitted to the appropriate Dis-
trict Office within 30 days of installation or first production,
whichever occurs first. All site security regulations as specified
in 43 CFR 3162.7 shall be adhered to. All product lines entering
and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will be effectively sealed in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-4,

A first production conference will be scheduled within 15 days
after receipt of the first production notice.

No well abandonment operations will be commenced without the prior
approval of the AO., 1In the case of newly drilled dry holes or
failures, and in emergency situations, oral approval will be ob-
tained from the AO. A "Subsequent Report of Abandonment" Form

- 3160-5, will be filed with the AO within 30 days following comple-

tion of the well for abandomment. This report will indicate where
plugs were placed and the current status of surface restoration.
Final abandonment will not be approved until the surface reclama-~
tion work required by the approved APD or approved abandonment
notice has been completed to the satisfaction of the AO or his
representative, or the appropriate Surface Managing Agency.

Pursuant to Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, lessees and operators
have the responsibility to see that their exploration, development,
production, and construction operations are conducted in a manner
which conforms with applicable Federal laws and regulations and
with State and local laws and regulations to the extent that such
State and local laws are applicable to operations on Federal or
Indian lands.



Other Information

All loading lines will be placed inside the berm surrounding the
tank battery.

All site security guidelines identified in 43 CFR 3162.7 regula-
tions will be adhered to.

-

All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on-
lease or off-lease will have prior written approval from the AO.

Gas meter runs for each well will be located within 500 feet of the
wellhead. The gas flowline will be buried or anchored down from
the wellhead to the meter and 500 feet downstream of-the meter run
or any production facilities. Meter runs will be housed and/or
fenced.

The oil and gas measurement facilities will be installed on the
well location. The oil and gas meters will be calibrated in place
prior to any deliveries. Tests for meter accuracy will be conduc-—
ted monthly for the first three months on new meter installations
and at least quarterly thereafter. The AO will be provided with a
date and time for the initial meter calibration and all future
meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports
will be submitted to the Vernal District Office. All meter mea-
surement facilities will conform with the API standards for liquid
hydrocarbons and the AGA standard for natural gas measurement.

The use of materials under BLM jurisdiction will conform to 43 CFR
3610.2-3.

There will be no deviation from the proposed drilling and/or work-—
over program without prior approval from the AO. Safe drilling and
operating practices must be observed. All wells, whether drilling,
producing, suspended, or abandoned will be identified in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.

"Sundry Notice and Report on Wells" (Form 3160-5) will be filed for
approval for all changes of plans and other operations in accord-
ance with 43 CFR 3162.3-2,

Section 102(b)(3) of the Federal 0il and Gas Royalty Management Act
of 1982, as implemented by the applicable provisions of the opera-
ting regulations at Title 43 CFR 3162.4-1(c), requires that 'not
later than the 5th business day after any well begins production on
which royalty is due anywhere on a lease site or allocated to a
lease site, or resumes production in the case of a well which has
been off production for more than 90 days, the operator shall notify
the authorized officer by letter or sundry notice, Form 3160-5, or
orally to be followed by a letter or sundry notice, of the date on
which such production has begun or resumed."



®

The date on which production is commenced or resumed will be con-
strued for oil wells as the date on which liquid hydrocarbons are
first sold or shipped from a temporary storage facility, such as a
test tank, and for which a run ticket is required to be generated
or, the date on which liquid hydrocarbons are first produced into a
permanent storage facility, whichever first occurs; and, for gas
wells as the date on which associated liquid hydrocarbons are first
sold or shipped from a temporary storage 'facility, such as a test
tank, and for which a run ticket is required to be generated or,
the date on which gas is first measured through permanent metering
facilities, whichever first occurs.

1If you fail to comply with this requirement in the manner and time
allowed, you shall be liable for a civil penalty of™up to $10,000
per violation for each day such violation continues, not to exceed
a maximum of 20 days. See Section 109(c)(3) of the Federal 0il and
Gas Royalty Management Act of 1982 and the implementing regulations
at Title 43 CFR 3162.4-1(b)(5)(ii).



. F orm 3160-3 . SBUBMIT IN C"LICATE® }};o:in, (.;ri-j., ved N
(November 1983 {Other ins pne on udget Burese Noo i ¥
) bl\ TED STATES reverse ) Expires Aupust 31, jo¢

(formerly 9-331C)

DEPARTMENT OF THE 'NTER‘OR 0. LEARE DEKIGNATION AND REKEIAD Ko
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 14-20-H62-1704
6. IF INDIAK, ALLOTTEE OR TBIRE NAMF

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL, DEEPEN, OR PLUG BACK ! '
Ute Indian Tribe

Ia. TYPK OF WORK
DRILL m DEEPEN D PLUG BACK D 7. UNIT AGREIMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF WELL N/A

oIL X oas :""“L' MULTIPLE §. FARM OR LEASKE NAME

wrLL LA WELL OTBER
2. NAME OF OPERATOR [ P Ute Tribal

Bow Valley Petroleum, Inc. WELL NO.
2-3472

3. ADDRESBS OF OPLRATOR

P.0. Drawer 130, Roosevelt, Utah 84066 ¢ JUN 16 1986 0. FIELD AND FOOL, OR WILDCAT

4 LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any Btate requirements.*) D/B] uebe] 1 mh
At surince D'VlS'ON OF 11, sEC, T., B, M \ox BLE
1957' FWL, 1223"' FSL, SE/SW " ano"sURVEY O anrs
| At proposed prod. sone O".. GAS & M'N'NG
| same Sec.34, TIN, R2W, USB&M
T4 DIRTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE® 12. COUNTY OB PARISE | 13. BTATE
PuesEs ve

3.5 miles due west of Neola

10. DISTANCE FROM PROPUBED® 1223' 16. NO. OF ACRES IN LEABK 17. NO. OF ACREB ABSIGNED
| LOCATION TO NEAREST TO THIS WELL

‘ g
| l(’i(i:: Bt? n(;l;r:‘:?s:ﬂlél.n:ﬁl?’)’lne, if any) 640 \ 640
18. DISTANCE Fi(OM rpoOroskp LOCATION® 19. PROPOSED DEPTH | 20. ROTARY OB CABLE TOOULS
‘B ‘ELL, Na, €O\ D,
B e o xhts iaase, r 2420, 53" 16,600" \ Rotary
2], BLEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, ete.) \/U 22. APPROX. DATE WORE WILL SETART®
5922' KB (est. ungraded G.L.) 6/86
23. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
SIZE OF ROLE BIZE OF CABING WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH QUANTITY OF CEMENT
30" 20" 52.73¢# 40" 175 sx(to surface)
12-1/4" 9-5/8" 40.00¢# 3000’ 900 sx(to surface)
8-3/4" 7" 26-32# 14200" 1500 sx(to surface)
6" 5" 18# 16000 700 sx(to top of Tiner)

This is a test of the Tertiary Wasatch Formation. Both the Wasatch and
Green River will be comingled in time. Minimum 3000 psi BOPE will be
installed and pressure tested to 3000 psi prior to drilling the surface
casing show at 3000'.

Minimum 5000 psi BOPD will be installed and tested to 5000 psi prior to
drilling the intermediate casing shoe at 14,200'. After drilling the shoe,
the casing will be tested to and EMJ of 14.5 opg.

deepen or plug back, give data on present productive sone and proposed new productive

IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGEAM : If proposal is to
inent data on subsurface locations and measured and true verticel depthe. Give blowout

gone. If proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give pert
preventer program, if any. .

21 i: ), 94 .
Iif////l Sr.District Enaineer parz __4-22-86
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APPROVED BY THE STATE
AR TAR DIVISTON OF
APPROVED BY J— OUGAS, AND MlNlNﬁn
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY © 3: TE: /é _7/6; g@/_)

PERMIT XO.

[t K T
SRACING: Lgee, 1307

d willfully to make to any department g///agérgo{ the

ns as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instructions’ dy

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it 8 crime for any person knowingly, an
United States any false. fictitious or fraudulent statements or representatio



NO°O02'W

TIN , R2W , US.B.GM

S89° 58'W

1957'

1223'

UTE TRIBAL # 2-34-22
Elev. Ungraded Ground - 592/'

PROJECT
BOW VALLEY PETROLEUM INC.

Well location, UTE TRIBAL #2-34-22,
located as shown in the SE /4 SWV/4
Section 34, TIN, R2W, U.S.B.&Mm.
Duchesne County , Utah.

- |NECEIVE)

DIVISION OF
OIL. GAS & MINING

NO°OI'w

CERTIFICATE

THIS IS 7O CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE PLAT wAS PREPARED FROM
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MADE BY ME OR UNDER MY
SUPERVISION AND THAT THE SAME ARE TRUE AND CORRECT TO THE
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE AND BELIEF.

i
'

REGISTERED LAND SURVEYOR
REGISTRATION N¢ 2454
STATE OF UTAH

UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
2648.76" (Measured) wesT PO BOX Q@ ~— 85SOUTH - 200 EAST
VERNAL, UTAH - 84078
SCALE " . DATE
i" = 1000’ 4/ 20/96
PARTY S S REFERENCES
X = Section Corners Located DA LDV ’ RP GLO Plat
’ WEATHER FILE
Fair BOW VALLEY
A




Attached

EXHIBIT "A"
TEN POINT COMPLIANCE PROGRAM

to Form 9-331C

WELL NAME: UTE TRIBAL 2-3412

LOCATION:

Section 34, TIN, R2W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, State of Utah

1. GEOLOGIC SURFACE FORMATION

Tertiary Duchesne River Formation

2. ESTIMATED TOPS OF IMPORTANT GEOLOGIC MARKERS

Duchesne River FM Surface
Lower Green River 10,022'
Wasatch Red Beds 11,322
Flagstaff 13,622'

3. ESTIMATED DEPTHS OF ANTICIPATED WATER, OIL, GAS, OR MINERALS

No water flows anticipated
0i1 and Gas 7350' to 11,300' GR - 13,600' to T.D. Wasatch

4. PROPOSED CASING PROGRAM

(a)

(b)

Conductor Casing: 20" to 40', 52.73#, K-55, 175 sacks cement to
surface. 9-5/8" surface casing to 3000', 40.00#, K-55, 900 sacks
cement to surface. 7" intermediate casing, 1500 sacks cement to
surface, 5" Tiner, 18#, P-110, 700 sacks "H" 14,000' to 16,000'.

Production Tubing: 2 7/8" tubing, 6.5#, N-80.

5. MINIMUM SPECIFICATIONS FOR PRESSURE CONTROL

EXHIBIT "B" is a schematic diagram of the blow out preventor
equipment. The BOP's will be hydraulically tested to the full
working pressure after nippling up and after any use under pressure.
Pipe rams will be operationally checked each 24 hours period, as will
blind rams each time pipe is pulled out of the hole. Such checks of
BOP will be noted on daily drilling reports.

Accessories to BOP include a kelly cock, floor safety valve, drill
string, BOP and choke manifold with pressure rating equivalent to
the BOP stack.



Attached to Form 9-331C (cont.)

6. TYPE AND CHARACTERISTICS OF THE PROPOSED CIRCULATING MUDS

0 - 7500' - Fresh Water
7500 - T.D. - Fresh Gel Mud (LSND)

7. AUXILIARY EQUIPMENT TO BE USED

5,000# WP Safety Valve, inside BOP, Upper Kelly Cock, Mud
Monitoring Equipment (See Exhibit "A").

8. TESTING, LOGGING AND CORING PROGRAMS

(a) Logging Program:
DIL-SFL w/GR - 2000' - T.D.
LSS, NGT, FDC-CNL, interval to be determined by wellsite
geologist
Mud Logging 7000' - T.D.

(b) Coring: No Cores

(c) Production:
If production is obtained, producing formation will be selectively
perforated and treated.

9. ANTICIPATED ABNORMAL PRESSURE OR TEMPERATURE

No abnormal pressure or temperature is anticipated.

10. ANTICIPATED STARTING DATE AND DURATION OF OPERATIONS

The anticipated starting date is Spring/Summer of 1986.
Operations should be completed within 120 days from spudding.



SOLEUM BLOW OUT PREV'ENTI‘ EQUIPMENT

s BOW VALLEY P

Rotate Heag Flow Line

Annular
Preventer

Fill Line

[ - » |

i | 1
Blind Rams

.- Pipe Rams Adjustable Choke
[ —J ] o ——— To Mud Tank
Kill Line > B

rasing . :
ﬂ>’< Head Hydraulic Choke

To Flare
Pit

To Gas
Buster

Minimum 3,000 PSI BOPE is to be installed after setting surface pipe.
All preventers are to be tested prior to drilling out casing shoe.

Minimum 5,000 PSI BOPE is to be installed after setting the long string.
The pipe rams and blind rams are to be tested to 5,000 PSI and the °
annular preventer to 1,500 PSI prior to drilling out shoe.

All auxillary BOPE will be tested to appropriate pressures when BOP's
are tested. (Manifold, upper and lower kelly cocks, valves, and

inside BOP).

After drilling the shoe, the casing seat will be pressure tested to an
equivalent mud weight of 14.5 PPg.



CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
FOR THE SURFACE USE PROGRAM OF THE
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

FOR
BOW VALLEY PETROLEUM, INC.
UPE TRIBAL #2-34-22
LEASE #14-20-H62-1704
LOCATED IN THE SE 1/4 SW 1/4

SECTION 34, T1N, R2W, U.S.B. & M.

SURFACE OWNERSHIP UTE TRIBE




BOW VALLY o ;7 ROI ' S .

Y
Ute Triba. #2-34-7. A? o
Section 34, T1K, RZ¥, U.S.B. & M.
| 2ty

THIRTEEN POINT SURFACE USE PROGRAM: “. ~

¥ b,

i

Multipoint Requirements to Accompany APD

1. Existing Roads -- describe the following and provide a legible map,
labeled and showing:

A. Proposed wellsite as staked and access route to location,
including distances from point where access route exits
established roads. (Actual staking should include two directional
reference stakes,) ’ -

B. Route and distance from nearest town or locatable reference point,
such as a highway or county road, to where well access route
leaves main road. Proceed west out of Neola, Utah on Neols Loop
Road + 4.5 miles; proceed north 0,9 miles to location,

C. Access road(s) to location color-coded or labeled.

D. Plans for improvement and/or maintenance of existing roads.

(Appropriate rights-of-way for off lease roads should be
attached,)

2. Planned Access Roads -- describe the following and provide a map of
suitable scale indicating all necessary access roads (permanent and
temporary) to be constructed or reconstructed, showing:

A. Length - N/A - Location built on existing road.

B. Width - 30 foot right-of-way with 18 foot running surface maximum,

C. Maximum grades - N/A

D. Turnouts - N/A

E. Drainage design - N/A

F. Location and size of culverts and/or bridges and brief description
of any major cuts and fills - N/A

G. Surfacing material (source) - N/A

H. Necessary gates, cattleguards, or fence cuts and/or modification
to existing facilities - N/A

I. Access road surface ownership - Ute Tribe

All travel will be confined to existing access road rights-of-way, BLO g
Access roads and surface disturbing activities will conform to standards
outlined in the USGS Publication (1978) Surface Operating Standards for
0il and Gas Development,

L MAY 2 8 1s5



e irival #2-34-Z2
Secevion 34, TIN, R2W, U.S.B. & M,

The road shall be upgraded to meet the standards of the anticipated
traffic flow and all-weather road requirements, Upgrading shall include
ditching, draining, graveling, crowning, and capping the roadbed as
necessary to provide a well constructed safe road. Prior to upgrading,
the road shall be cleared of any snow cover and allowed to dry
completely, Traveling off the 30 feet right-of-way will not be allowed.
Road drainage crossings shall be of the typical dry creek drainage
crossing type. Crossings shall be designed so they will not cause
siltation or accumulation of debris in the drainage crossing nor shall the
drainages be blocked by the roadbed. Erosion of drainage ditches by
runoff water shall be prevented by diverting water off at frequent
intervals by means of cutouts, Upgrading shall not be allowed during
muddy conditions. Should mud holes develop, they shall be filled in and
detours around them avoided,

X The operator/lessee or his successor shall be responsible for all
maintenance on cattleguards or gates associated with this oil and
or gas operation, y
3. Location of Existing Wells -- describe the following and provide a map
or plat of all wells within a ome nile radius of the proposed well
location showing and identifying existing:

A, Vater wells One

B, Abandoned wells None
C. Temporarily abandoned wells One

D. Disposal wells None
E. Drilling wells None
F. Producing wells Four
G. Shut-in wells None
H. Injection wells None

4. Location of Existing and/or Proposed Facilities

A. On well pad: Show the following existing area facilities and
dimensions to be utilized if the well is Successfully completed for
production (detail painting plans and color if applicable):

(1) Tank batteries

(2) Production facilities

(3) 0il gathering lines

(4) Gas gathering lines

(5) Injection lines

(6) Disposal lines

(1) surface pits (separate application per NFL-2B requirements)#

(Indicate if any of the above lines are buried,)

B. Off well pad: Same as above, Off lease flowlines may require
‘rights-of-way or special use permits, check with the Area (Qffice

Realty Specialist, (Include a diagram of the proposed attendant
lines, i.e., flowlines, powerlines, etc,, if off well pad

location,)

2.
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(1) Proposed location and attendant lines shall be flagged off of
well pad prior to archaeological clearance,

(2) Dimensions of facilities
(3) Construction methods and materials

(4) Protective measures and devices to protect livestock and wildlife

Note: Operator has option of submitting information under 44 and B.,

after well is completed for production, by applying for approval
of subsequent operations,

If a tank battery is constructed on this lease, the battery or the
well pad will be surrounded by a dike of sufficient capacity to
contain 1 1/2 times the storage capacity of the battery. The
integrity of the dike must be maintained,

Tank batteries will be placed on the Northeast side of the location
between points 2 and 8 on plat cut sheet.

All permanent (on site for six months or longer) structures
constructed or installed (including pumping units) will be painted a
flat, non-reflective, earthtone color to match one of the standard
environmental colors, as determined by the Rock Mountain Five State
Interagency Committee, All facilities will be painted within six
months of installation. Facilities required to comply with 0.S.H.A.
(Occupation Safety and Health Act) will be excluded.

The required paint color is Slate Gray (5 Y 6/1)

Location of Type of Water Supply

A. Show location and type of water supply, either by 1/4, 1/4 section
on a map or by written description from the Ute Tribe Water -~
Cottonwood Creek 1850' FWL 1223' FSL Section 34, T1N, RAW, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah.

B. State method of transporting water, and show any roads or
pipelines needed, Water will be pumped from creek to holding
pond,

C. If water well is to be drilled on lease, so state, No

*The operator will be responsible for acquiring the necessary
permit to obatin water to be used for drilling activites,

Source of Construction Materials

A, ©Show information either on map or by written description -
gravel from John Fausett pit
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B, Identify if from Federal or Indian (tribal or allotted) land,

N/A

C. Describe where materials such as sand, gravel, stone, and soil
materials are to be obtained and used. None

All topsoil will be stripped to 6" and stockpiled at the Southeast
end of the location,.

*If fill materials are needed to construct roads or well sites,
proper permits must be obtained from the Surface Management

Agency, unless materials are obtained from a private source.

*A minerals material application is not required,

7. Methods for Handling Waste Disposal

A. Describe methods and location of proposed safe containment and
disposal of each type of waste material, including:

(1) Cuttings: Contained in pit on the Northeast side of
location.

(2) Sewage: Portable chemical toilet

(3) Garbage (trash) and other waste material: Contained in wire
basket and hauled to landfill.

é4§ Salts: Contained in pit

5) Chemicals: Contained in pit.

B. Provide a plan for eventual disposal of drilling fluids and any
produced o0il or water recovered during testing operations. These
will be contained in pit until dry, and then covered with earth,

hazardous wastes will be hauled by truck to the nearest disposal
pond,

*Burning will not be allowed. All trash must be contained in a
trash cage and hauled away to an approved disposal site at the
completion of the drilling activities,

¥Pits are not to be located in natural drainages where a flood
hazard exists or surface runoff will destroy or damage the pit
walls, unless otherwise herein provided.

On BIA administered lands:

All reserve pits will be lined with either native clay, commercial

bentonite or plastic sufficient to prevent seepage. If a plastic nylon
reinforced liner is used, it shall be torn and perforated after the pit
drys and before backfilling of the reserve pit. 2#/square feet of

commercial bentonite mixed into the top one foot of £ill. (No KCI H20 or
chromdtes will be used).

X To protect the environment (without & chemical analysis)., Pits

will be constructed so as not to leak, break, or allow discharge
of liquids,

4.
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Produced waste water will be confined to a lined pit or storage tank for a
period not to exceed 90 days after initial production. During the 90 day
period an application for approval of a permanent disposal method and
location, along with required water analysis, will be submitted for the
AO's approval, Failure to file an application within the time allowed
will be considered an incident of noncompliance,

B. Ancillary Facilities

A. Identify all proposed camps and airstrips on a map as to their
location, and area required, and construction methods., (Camp
center and airstirip centerlines to be staked on the ground),

X Camp facilities or airstrips will not be required.

9. Well Site Layout -- provide a plat (not less than 1" = 50') showing:

A, Cross-sections of proposed drill pad with approximate cuts and
fills and the relation to topography.

B. Location of mud tanks, reserve, blooie, and emergency pits, pipe
racks, living facilities, and soil material stockpiles, etc.
(Approval as used in this section means field approval of
location.)

C. Rig orientation, parking areas, and access roads, etc,

All pits will ©be fenced with a wire mesh fence and topped with at least
one strand of barbed wire. The reserve pit fencing will be on three sides
during drilling operations and on the fourth side when the rig moves off
the location, Any hydrocarbons on the pit will be removed from the pit as
soon as possible after drilling operations are completed, Pits will be
fenced and maintained until clean-up.

The fence will be comstructed as prescribed in the USGS Publication (1978)
Surface QOperating Standards for 0il and Gas Development, Alternatives to
the prescribea standards shall be submitted to the Authorized Officer for
approval,

Well Site Layout: The reserve pit will be located on the: Southeast side
of the location,

The stockpiled topsoil will be stored on the: Southwest corner of the
location by point #6 (between 5 and 6),

Access to the well pad will be from the: West side of the location

The diversion ditch shall be constructed on the Northeast side of the
location draining to the Southeast,

10, Plans for Restoration of Surface

A, Provide a restoration program upcn completion of operationms,
including:

5.
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(1) Backfilling, leveling, recontouring, and waste disposal;
segregation of topsoil from cut materials as needed,

(2) Revegetation and rehabilitation--including abandoned access
roads or portions of well pads no longer needed (normally
per BLM recommendations)

(3) Proposed timetable for commencement and completion of
rehabilitation operations 90 days after completion of
operations,

B. The following are provisions to be addressed in the restoration
plan:

Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area will
be cleared of all debris, materials, trash and junk not required for
production,

Before any dirt work to restore the location takes place, the reserve pit
must be completely dry and all cans, barrels, pipe, etc, will be removed.
The reserve pit and that portion of the location and access road not
needed for production facilities/operations will be reclaimed, The
reserve pit will be reclaimed within 90 days from the date of well
completion and prior to first snow fall,

All disturbed areas will be recontoured to the approximate natural
contours,

The stockpiled +topsoil will be evenly distributed over the disturbed
areas,

Prior +to reseeding, all disturbed areas, including the access roads, will
be scarified and left with a rough surface.

Seed will be broadcast or drilled at a time specificed by the BIA., If
broadcast, a harrow or some other implement will be dragged over the
seeded area to assure seed coverage and the seed mixture will be
proportionately larger (double the lbs, per acre),

An appropriate seed mixture will be determined by the BIA, either as part
of the Conditions of Approval of the APD or at the time restoration
activities are scheduled to begin, '

All seeding will be done from September 15 until the ground freezes.

At such time as the well is plugged and abandoned the operator will submit

a surface reclamation plan to the Surface Management Agency for prescribed
seed mixture and reseeding requirements,

If the seeding is unsuccessful, the lessee/operator may be required to
make subsequent seedings.
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On BIA administered lands:

Abandoned well sites, roads, or other disturbed areas will be restored to
near their original condition, This procedure will include: (a)
reestablishing irrigation systems where applicable, (b) reestablishing
80il conditions in irrigated fields in such a way as to insure cultivation
and harvesting of crops and, (c) insuring revegetation of the disturbed
areas to the specifications of the Ute Indian Tribe or the BIA at the time
of abandonment,

The operator will submit a plan of controlling noxious weeds along
rights-of-way for roads, pipelines, well sites or other applicable
facilities, A list of noxious weeds can be obtained from the appropriate
county extension office,

The BLM recommends the following procedure for reclamation:

Compacted areas of the well pad should be plowed or ripped to a depth of
12" before reseeding., Seeding should be done with a disc-type drill to
ten inches apart. The seed should be planted between one-half inch deep
and three quarter inch deep. A drag, packer or roller may be used to
insure uniform coverage of the seed, and adequate compaction, Drilling of
the seed should be done on the contour where possible. Where slopes are
too steep for contour drilling a "“cyclone" hand-seeder or similar
broadcast seeder should be used, using twice the recommended seed per
acre, Seed should then be covered to a depth described above by what-ever
means is practical.

11, Surface Qwnership: Ute Tribal

Provide the surface ownership (Federal, Indian, State or private) at the
well location, and for all 1lands crossed by roads which are to be
constructed or upgraded.

Where the surface of the well site is privately owned, the operator shall
provide the name, address, and, if known, telephone number of the surface

owner,

12, Other Additional Information

The BLM recommends a general description of:

A. Topography, soil characteristics, geologic features, flora, and
fauna. The topography of the area is flat, being a portion of
the Southern end of the Coyote Basin, Side hills are steep, with
large outcrops of sandstone. The soil in the area consists of
sandy clay material, light brown in color. The area is sparsley
vegetated with some small areas of bunch grass, with the primary
vegetation being sagebrush and greasewood. The animals that are
in the area are mainly deer, antelope, rabbit and other small
rodents, There are also some reptiles found in the area
consisting of snakes, lizards and horned toads., Birds of the area
consist of raptors, finches, crows and jays.

7.
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B. Other surface-use activities and surface ownership of all involved
lands -~ grazing.

C. Proximity of water, occupied dwellings, archaeological, historical

or cultural sites. The Cottonwood Creek is located approximately
200' West of the location,

A cultural resource clearance will be required before any construction
begins on Federal and Indian lands., However, historic and cultural
resource work shall be undertaken only with the written consent of a
private surface owner., If the private surface owner refuses entry for
that purpose, the lessee or operator shall use its best efforts to conduct
its approved operations in a manner that avoids adverse effects on any
properties which are listed, or may be eligible for listing, in the NRHP.

If, during operations, any archaeological or historical sites, or any
object of antiquity (subject to the Antiquities Act of June 8, 1906) are
discovered, &ll operations which would affect such sites are to be
suspended and the discovery reported promptly to the Surface MNangement
Agency.

On BLM administered land, it is required that a proposed use of pesticide,
herbicide or other possible hazardous chemicals shall be cleared for use

prior to application,

On BIA administered land:

Operator's employees, including subcontractors, will not gather firewood
along roads constructed by operators. If wood cutting is required, a
permit will be obtained from the Forestry Department of the BIA pursuant
to 25 CFR 169.13 "Assessed Damages Incident to Right-of-Way
Authorization”, All operators, sub-contractors, vendors and their
employees or agents may not disturb saleable timber (including firewood)
without a duly granted wood permit from the BIA Forester.

If the surface rights are owned by the Ute Indian Tribe and mineral rights
are owned by the another entity, an approved rights-of-way will be
obtained from the BIA Dbefore the operator begins any construction
activities, If the surface is owned by another entity and the mineral
rights are owned by the Ute Irdian Tribe, rights-of-way will be obtained
from the other entity.

All roads constructed by operators on the Uintah and Ouray Indian
Reservation will have appropriate signs, Signs will be neat and of sound
construction, They will state: (a) that the land is owned by the Ute
Indian Tribe, (b) the name of the operator, (c) that firearms are
prohibited to all non-Ute Tribal members, (d) +that permits must be
obtained from the BIA before cutting firewood or other timber products and
(e) only authorized personnel permitted,

All well site locations on the Uinteh and Ouray Indian Reservation will
have an approporiate sign indicating the name of the operator, the lease
serial number, the well name and number, the survey description of the
well (either footages or the quarter-quarter section, the section,
township and range).

8.
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Additional Surface Stipulations for BLM, BIA, FS, DWR, or Private Surface
Lands:

The operator or his contractor shall contact the BLM Officie at (801)
789-1362 (BLM) between 24 and 48 hours prior to construction activities.
Contact Tim O'Brien .

X Overhead flagging will be installed on pits to protect waterfowl and
birds.

X  The blooie pit will be located in the Southwest corner between points
5 and 6.,

Rotate the location 90° counter clockwise

X
X Reroute existing road west of the location,
X  Reroute existing pipeline east of the location,

Grazing Permittee Ute Tribe assignment/Norma Jean Gray

Address Phone No,

Note: If the land is privately owned, these surface stipulations may be
varied to comply with the operator - land owner agreement.

13, Lessee's or Operators Representative and Certification

Representative

Name: Bow Valley Petroleum, Inc,

Address: P,0. Box 130, Roosevelt, Utah 84066

Phone No. (801) 722-5166

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that
full compliance is made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore 0il
and Gas Orders, the approved plan of operations, and any applicable Notice
to Lessees. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his
sub-contractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished the field
representative to insure compliance,

The dirt contractor will be provided with an approved copy of the Surface
Use Plan from the APD,

This drilling permit will be valid for a period of one year from the date
of approval, After permit termination, & new application will be filed
for approval for any future operations,
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Certification:

I hereby certify that I, or persons under my direct supervision, have
inspected the proposed drillsite and access route; that I am familiar with
the conditions which currently exist; that the statements made in this
plan are true and correct to the best of my knowledge; and, that the work
associated with the operations proposed here will be performed by Bow
Valley Petroleum, Inc. and its contractors and subcontractors ~ in
conformity with +this plan and the terms and conditions under which it is
approved, This statement is subject to the provisions of 18 U,S.C. 1001
for the filing of a false statement,.

Senior District Engineer
me and Title

’ ate Matk Wagner

Onsite Date: May 2, 1986

Participants on Joint Inspection

B.L.M. John Fausett
B.I.A. Bow Valley Petroleum, Inc,
Ute Tribe

Chase Drilling

10.
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4 )‘ STATE OF UTAH Norman H. Bangerter, @governor

NATURAL RESOURCES Dee C. Hansen, Executive Director
water Rights Robert L. Morgan, State Engineer

Eastern Area « State/County Building + 152 E. 100 North * Vemal, UT 84078-2110 - 801-789-3714

Jur/le 13, 1986 D E©EEWE o~

JUN 18 1986

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS & MINING

Bow Valley Petroleum, Inc.
P. 0. Box 130
Roosevelt, Utah 84066

RE: Temporary Change 86-43-32

Gentlemen:

The above numbered Temporary Change Application has been
approved, subject to prior rights.

A copy is herewith returned to you for your records and
future reference.

Sincerely yours,

POLAW M s

for Robert L. Morgan, P. E.
State Engineer

an equal opportunity employer
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Form 111 8.61.2M . ] )
: APPLICATION NO % - 6/ - I

Application For Temporary Change of Point of Diversion,
Place or Purpose of Use

STATE OF UTAH

(To Be Filed in Duplicate)

...................................................................................

Place Date

For the purpose of obtaining permission to temporarily change the point of diversion, place or purpose of use
{Strike out written matter not needed)

of water, the right to the use of which was acquired by.UTETRIBE(43‘3230.)A']-.2624 ..........................
(Give No. of application, title and date of Decree and Award No.)
to that hereinafter described, application is hereby made to the State Engineer. based upon the following showing of

facts, submitted in accordance with the requirements of the Laws of Utah.
1. The owner of right or application is. ...__. ‘UTE--TR..IBE ............................................................................

2. The name of the person making this application is...UIE;.T.RIBE-.C/.O.._B.OW...VALLEY...P_EIROLEUM o INC.o.....
3. The post office address of the applicant |sPgOtDRAWERJ.;‘%Q.-,ROOSEVELT&UTM84066 ..................

PAST USE OF WATER

4. The flow of water which has been used in second feetis._......._.. N/ B
5. The quantity of water which has been used in acre feet ls% ..... ) JO’O .......................................
6. The water has been used each year from._-.‘..--..N/A.--..-.--.-........._.; L7 TSRO incl
{Month) (Day) ‘ (Month) _ (Day)
7. The water has been stored each year fromN/A .............................. 7 TR . incl.
‘ (Month) (Day) (Month) (Day)
8. The direct source of supply lsCOTTONWOODCREEK .............. 11 SRS DUCHESNE ... County.
- . B ; "\
9. The water has beeh diVerted into_ ... ORI 99&5 at a point located. 52 E2800' from Ni Cor.
Sec.16, T3N, R3W, USB&M : o, 7 -
10. The waier involved has been used for the following purpose: ..... Irrigation & Stockwater

NOTE: If for irrigation, give legal subdivisions of land and total acreage which has been irrigated. If for other purpses, give ‘ |
place and purpose of use.

THE FOLLOWING TEMPORARY CHANGES ARE PROPOSED

11. The flow of water to be changed in cubic feet per second ' is . ... . .o i e
12. The quantity of water to be changed in acre-feetis ..........._.... Three acre feet oo
. . .
13. The water will be diverted into the....... P1p611ne ............... ngfax at a point located 1850““”"1223'}:3[- ’

....................................................................................................................................................

14. The change will be made from...._.... May]‘ .................. . 1986 ..... N 7 I 0 CtOber?)O’ ............. . 1986

15. The reasons for the change are___.. Water will _be. purchased. from the Ute Indian Tribe to drill

16. ‘The water involved herein has heretofore been temporarily changed ................____. years prior to this application.

17. The water involved is to be used for the following purpose: JDrilling and compieting Bow Valley. ..

NOTE: If for irrigation, give legal subdivisions of land to be irrigated. If for other purposes, give place and purpose of pro posed use.

EXPLANATORY

........................................................................................................................................................

A filing fee in the sum of $5.00 is submitted herewith. I agree to pay an additional fee for either investigating or ad-
vertising this change, or both, upon the request of the State Engineer.




RULES AND REGULATIONS
(Read Carefully)

This application blank is to be used only for temporary change of point of diversion, place or nature of s ;

EEAS A ]
definitely fixed period not to exceed one year. If a permanent change is desired, request proper application blanks from
the State Engineer.

Application for temporary change must be filed in duplicate, accompanied by a filing fee of g7.50 Where the water

affected is under supervision of a Water Commissioner, appointed by the State Engineer, time will be saved if the
~ Application is filed with the Commissioner, who will promptly investigate the proposed change and forward both copies
with filing fee and his report to the State Engineer. Applications filed directly with the State Engineer will be mailed

to the Water Commissioner for investigation and report. If there be no Water Commissioner on the source, the Appli-
cation must be filed with the State Engineer.

When the State Engineer finds that the change will not impair the rights of others he will authorize the change
to be made. If he shall find, either by his own investigation or otherwise, that the change sought might impair existing
rights he shall give notice to persons whose rights might be affected and shall give them opportunity to be heard before

publication in a newspaper. Before making an investigation or Biving notice the State Engineer will require the appli-
cant to deposit a sum of money sufficient to pay the expenses thereof.

Address all communications to:
State Engineer
State Capitol Building
Salt Lake City, Utah

STATE ENGINEER'S ENDORSEMENTS
(Not to be filled in by applicant)

Recommendation of Commissioner

2. .é:-g"f:é .-.Application receiv

be mail 0 State Engineer's Office by
E N Fee for filing application, $7.50 received DY e
O Application returned, with letter, to ........... ...
O Corrected application resubmitted ov;ryc;t;?lter to State Engineer's Office.
6. e Fee for investigation requested $.._..__._.._._..._______
[ [ Fee for investigation $..__.._..__.____ .received by ._.._.. .. ... .. :Rec.No. ................
U Investigationmade by ... : Recommendations: .............__. ..
O e, Fee for giving notice requested $...._.__._.._ ..
N Fee for giving notice $........__.____ .received by _.._____..__.___. .. ... .. :Rec. Noo..ooooooeo....
3 S Application approved for advertising by publl!il(;ai]tlon By e
) b 2 Notice published in............. e
18 e Notice of pending change application mailed to interested partiesby ___._..____. as follows:
) L T Change application protested DY e
(Date Received and Name)
I T Hearingsetfor ... ... B LSO
16, e el Application recommended formy' ..............................................................
17 6"(0’?‘ ......... Change Application 551 oveq and returned to ..o

................................................................................................................................................

Gdt L,

Robert L. Morgan, P. E. State Engineer




K . U ITED STATES .

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTLERIOR
BURLAU OF INDIAN AFFPAIRS
vintah and Ouray Agency

Fort Dbuchesne, Utah 840206

PERMIT FOR USE OF WATER

1. Permission is granted to BOW VALLEY PETROLEUM, INC. )

hereinafter referred to as Permittee, by the Ute Indian Tribe, hereinafter referred
to as Permitter, to use water for the purpose of an oil and/or gas well drilling

operation located in SELSWYL Section 34, TIN, R2W, USM, Duchesne County, Utah /

water to be drawn from Cottonwood Creek (43-3230) A-12624

2. 1In consideration of the water claimed by the Ute Indian Tribe, the Permittee
will pay the sum of $_3500.00 by check, payable to the Bureau of Indian Affairs.
3. The Permittee agrees:

a. The Permitter can make no guarantee as to amount of or time of year that
such water will be available. It is understood that availability is totally depen-
dent on the natural supply of water,

b. All facilities including, but not limited to pipe and pumps, installed by
the Permittee must be of such nature and design so as not to in any way interfere

with the delivery of irrigation water.

c. Upon completion or apparent abandonment of the oil and/or gas well for
which this drilling permit is granted, the Permittee will repair any damages and
remove or be responsible for the cost of removal of any facilities installed by the
Permittee.

d. LIABILITY: Permittee is liable for all damages that result from his oper-
ations, or for injury to the Permitter or his property, including livestock; to
lessees, licensees and surface owners. The Permittee agrees to save and hold
harmless the Permitter and the United States and its officers, representatives and

employees, and the surface owners or their tenants from all suits for injury or

claims for damage to persons and property from the Permittee's operations under



IS

« this pernit.

e. BOND: To guarantec pceytormance uander this permit, a bond is Lo be fur-

nished as follows: ‘ RBond #708E192-4
Travelers $15,000.00

£. TERM: Permittee is granted use of water subject to conditions hercinabove

stated for a period beginning with the date of approval of this permit, and ending

upon completion of the well or 90 days after the date of approval (which ever comes

first).

g. All conditions of this permit are thoroughly understood and only those
specifically stated herein are intended to be qranted.

h. Issue copy of permit to each water hauler.
i. Remind company personnel that carrying firearms while on the Uintah and

Ouray Reservation 1is prohibited.

PERMITTEE :
N BOW VALLEY PETROLEUM, INC. [ |
.,,»97:/74‘%*4@[&%% : 'l
d (Namc—and-—+ftle typed) )
Charles C. Gardner /

District Superintendent

ATTEST, Xé?/,
7’

@iﬁ*etary, Uintah and Ouray
Bufiness Committee .

Busin;Zs Commlttee

JUN & 1980 3 EXPIRES: ‘n/pyi s /?5("

(date) (date)

APPROVED:

tah and Ouray Agency .
ﬁ\ PK‘!‘ :"7'6“',”(}&;“




® @ ‘

7 : ~
OPERATOR o 2?2422%7 éﬁZZéiééazn~{ wAeaw . DATE b
/ 4
WELL NAME  ZZ AAl R- 342 o

SEC SESW I¥¢ T s 4 R X &4/ COUNTY Aﬁ&auéehw//
LD-0/% = 367 Qe
API NUMBER TYPE OF LEASE
CHECK OFF:
PLAT BOND ] NEAREST
g e ¥ WELL
LEASE ] FIELD ] POTASH OR
> v " | OIL SHALE

PROCESSING COMMENTS:
K — (e [3E R

: A
A%/GU o - #LJZ«S%?fuﬁll C;;;/ f%éi¢ijgi

APPROVAL LETTER:

SPACING: 203 302
) UNIT
- i N et 302.1
CAUSE NO. & DATE

STIPULATIGONS:

6218T



k‘ )‘ STATE OF UTAH B Norman H. Bangerter, Governor

v NATURAL RESOURCES - Dee C. Hansen, Executive Director

Oil, Gas & Mining _ . Dianne R. Nielson, Ph.D., Division Director
355 W. North Temple - 3 Triad Center - Suite 350 - Sait Lake City, UT 84180-1203 - 801-638-5340

June 18, 1986

Bow Valley Petroleum, Inc.
P. O. Drawer 130
Roosevelt, Utah 84066

G’entlemen:

Re: -Well Name: Ute Tribal 2-3472 - SE SW Sec 34, T. IN, R. 2W
12737 FoL, 1957 FW. - Duchesne County, Ufaﬁ

Approval to drill the referenced well is hereby granted in accordance
with the Order of Cause No. 139-42 dated April 17, 1985.

In addition, the following actions are necessary to fully comply with
this approval: '

1. Spudding notification to the Division within 24 hours after drilling
operations commence.

2. Submittal to the Division of complei:ed Form OGC-8-X, Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling.

3. Prompt notification to the Division should you determine that it is
‘necessary to plug and abandon this well. Notify John R. Baza,
Petroleum Engineer, (Office) (801) 538-5340, (Home) 298-7695, or
R. J. Firth, Associate Director, (Home) 571-6068.

4, Compliance with the requirements and regulations of Rule 311.3,
Associated Gas Flaring, 0il and Gas Conservation General Rules.

5. Prior to commencement of the proposed drilling operations, plans for
toilet facilities and the disposal of sanitary waste at each drill
site shall be submitted to the local health department having
jurisdiction. Any such drilling operations and any subsequent well
operations must be conducted in accordance with applicable State and
local health department regulations. A list of all local health
departments and copies of applicable regulations are available from
the Division of Environmental Health, Bureau of General Sanitation,
telephane (801) 533-6163.

an aqual opportunity @mpicy e



Page 2
Bow Valley Petroleum, Inc.

Well Name: Ute Tribal 2-34Z2
June 18, 1986

6. This approval shall expire one (1) year after date of issuance unless
- substantial and continuous operation is underway or an application
. for an extension is made prior to the approval expiration date.

The API number assigned to this well is 43-013-31167.

Sincerely,
R ixth
Associate Director, 0il & Gas
as
Enclosures

cc: Branch of Fluid Minerals
Bureau of Indian Affairs
D..R. Nielson

8159T




. . Water Permit OK

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPLIDING INFORMATION ~ APT #43-013-31167
NAME OF COMPANY: BOW VALLEY PETROLEUM

WELL NAVE: UTE TRIBAL 2-3472
SECTION_SE S 34 TOWNSHIP___IN  PANGE__ 2 __ (oUNTY___ Duchesne
DRILLING CONTRACTOR Cachuna |
RIG #_g
SPUDDED:  DATE__6-19-86
TIME___3:00 PM

HOW Raota Ty

DRILLING WILL COMMENCE

REPORTED BY Michelle

TELEPHONE #

DATE 6-19-86 ﬁ SIGNED AS




i .
]

i ;‘:\ ¢} 1. :
For dloo ! ED STATES BUBMIT 1IN T.‘AT)"' P orer ;
(Noventer Jag3) (Other instruf oL re AN : vobs
(Foermerhy 9-331) DEPARTML T OF THE lNTERIOR verse alde) C5 LEARE DERD AT N AN BEAIAD MG

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 14-20-H62-1704
G I} ENDIAN, ALLOTTEE Ok TRIBE NaME
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
(Do not upse this fot;: ‘f'oArP‘;”l(: é);gl!;otrg g_gg ;rsach?;_e—f:n':: ﬂff&;ﬁ.ﬁ’.ﬂ Qifferent reservolr. Ute Tribe
i "7 UNIT ACOEEEMENT NaNE
vien 0 ¥ O o » N/A
27 NANE OF OPERATOR v 8. FANM Ok LEABE NAMEK
Bow Valley Petroleun, Inc. B UTE
3. aDDRESBE OF OPERATOX . ©. WBLL NO.
P.0. Drawer 130, Roosevelt, Utah 34066 2-3472
4 T TOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any Btate requirements.® T 7 777 1710, FIELD 4ND POOL, OR WILDCAT
See also space 17 below.) .
At surface Bluebell

11, amc, 7., R, M., OR BLK. AND
SURVEY OR AREA

1957' FWL, 1223' FSL, SE SW
Sec.34, TIN, R

14. PERMIT NO. 16. ELZVATIONS (Show whether pr, w1, GR, etc.) 12. COUNTY OR PARISH| 18. 8T4TE
!
5922' unaraded G.L. Duchesne Utah
1 Check Apprepriate Box Te Indicote Mature of Notice, Report, or Other Date
NOTICE 0OF INTENTION TO: SUBBEQUEKT REPORT OF :
TEST WATER SEUT-OFF PCLL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REFAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTUBE TREATMENT ALTERING CABING
8HOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON® SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING | ABANDONMENT®
REPAIR WELL CHANGE FPLANSE (Other) Renort_of Soud
(NOTE : Report results of multipie completion on Well
{Other) ___(‘umpletlon or Recowapletion Beport and Log form.)

;7 DESTRIB}. MKOPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, Including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locatiuns and meastred and true vertical depthe for all markers and sones perti-
nent to this work.) *

This well was spudded 6-19-86 @ 3:00 p.m. Spud was reported to
Arlene at State 011, Gas & Mininog 8 3:30 p.m. same day per telephone
conversation, and to Mary at BLM @ 8:30 a.m. 6-23-86.

Drilling contractor for this well is Cachuma Drilling Company,
Rig 8, P.0. Box 1228, Vernal, Utah 84078.

AYANNY JUN R 4 1986

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS & MINING

18. 1 hereby certu" that the logolng is tr e and correct
Nt D1 DA s . s
SIGNED e o __Ena.Technician pate _0-23-866

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*Gee Instructions on Reverse Side

Title 16 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make tec any depsrtment ur agency of the
United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.




i

Terr B At
B} RIS BT A

Yyort UNITED STATLS
DEPARTMENZOF THE INTERIOR verse siee)
GEOLWICAL SURVEY @72&7

SURNIT IN TRIFLICATE®

R I YR -
Tindzet Bureaw No. 42-R1424.

(Other furiructiors on re

G LLASE ULEICNATION AKD BLRIAL NO.

14-20-H62-1704

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

€. 37 INDIAN, ALLOTTEE O% TRIBE NANE

{Do pot use this nir’: E?Py;ﬁpgﬂ;ol; ;82 ;'E;&(‘l’?—‘:‘e"{:: ‘pl“&x’b':ck to .) different reservolr. UTE TRIBE
3. D NIy 7. UNIT ACAREMENT NAME
e weLL po— ’ N/A
2. XiME OF OPERATOR i ] " . FPARM OR LEABE MNAME
Bow Valley Petroleum, Inc. JUL 2 2 1986 Ute
3. AvDEIas OF OPERATOR - 8. wWxLL NO.
P.0. Drawer 130, Roosevelt, Utah 84066 DIVISION OF 2-3472
4. &c;.ﬁzu.::c:'i?b:ﬁ:xgﬂ Jocation clearly and in fccord:bcc with any State mtl'rw& M'N'NG 10. FizLD AND POOL, OR WILDCAY
At surface _ _ Bluebell- Wasatch
* 1223' FSL, 1957 .FWL, SE SW 11. sEcC., T. R, M_, OR BLK. AND
SURYEY OR ARRA
, Sec. 34, TIN, R2W
14. PERIT NO. 15. ELXVATIONS (Sbov whether DF, BT, GX, ete.) 12. COUXTY OR FaxiSR} 13. STATE
43-013-31167 '5921"' (Ungr GL) Duchesne Utah

18. Check Appropriate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data

NOTICR OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:

TEST WATER BEUT-OFY
TFRACTORE TREAT
SHOOT Ok ACIDIZE

REFAIR WELL

- PFOULL OR ALTER CASING

MOLYIPLE COMPLETE

ABANDON®

CHANGCE PLANB

WATER SBOT-OFF

FRACTURE TREATMENT

RRWOUTING OR ACIDILING

Monthly .Drilling Report X

REPAIRING WERLL

ALTERING CABING

ABANDONMENT®

{Other)

oTE : Report results of multiple completion on Well

éN
(Other) ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

37. DESCRIBE FROFGSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent detaifls, and Zive pertinent dates, Including estimated date of starting :xg
proposed work. 1{ well is directionally drilled, give subsurface Jocations and mcasured and true vertical depths for all markers nn_d zones pe

nent to this work.) ®

MONTHLY DRILLING REPORT
FOR JUNE 1986

DATE DAY DRLG DEPTH  OPERATION
June 19 1 1026'  Spud well ©3:30 p.m., Drlg 124" hole.
June 20 2 2263'  Drilling 12%" hole.
June 21 3 3200' POOH to run 9-5/8" csg. Circ hole.
June 22 4 3200'  Run & cmt 9-5/8" csg.
June 23 5 3200'  WOC & Drlg cmt.
June 24 6 3575' Drlg cmt & 8-3/4" hole.
June 25 7 4315'  Drilling 8-3/4" hole.
June 26 8 5040' "
June 27 9 5635" .
June 28 10 6056 "
June 29 11 6501' "
June 30 12 6903’ "

18. 1 bereby certify

" 7-21-86

SIGNED wr e ENg. TeChnician DATE
{This space for Federal or State office use)
. . )
° APPROVID BY TITLE DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANX:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side . ' ' 3




boor 5 Ui & Priad C RMUENG N LRIFLICATE® b s pRit e
B YORE T BT e} | “a o “! (Oiber Tntirvetion Nndcet Yureaw Ko 47 1 34c
DEPART?‘AE’ F IHt ”YTER!OR vn|n :240) frutiggl " L LEAME LEISICNATIOS AND BiRIsL ME
GEOLTGICAL SURVEY OR1 390 14-20-H(2- 170
€. )r INDIAN, ALLOTTKE OR TRIBE WANK
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS :
(De pot waz 1b1s form for proposals te &riil or 1o deepes or Plug buck to a @ificrent veservols. .
Use “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" foc suck proposala) Ute Tribe
3. 7. UNIT SCREENMENT NiMB
on cap
wErl wIlLlL OTRER N/[\

2 MaMB OF OPLRATOB D Eu 4 8. FABM OB LEABZ WAME
BOW VALLEY PETROLEUM, INC. @ W ] UTE

¥ aApnxzas oF OrrzaATOR §. WXLl NO.

P.0. DRAWER 130, ROOSEVELT, UTAH 84066 AUG 111986 ' 2-3472

wwocation or weLl {Report Jocation clearly ané ip accordance with any Btate requirements.® 10. FIZLD AXD FOOL, O WILDCAY

e See also space 17 below.) ]
A DIVISION OF Bluebell-Wesatch
4 1223 ' FSL » 1957 "L FWL 3 SE SW O"_' GAS & M!N'NG 11. u:;:'..‘:..o:.,‘:::x_x. AND

Sec. 34, TIN, R2W

12. COUNTY OR FaxisE| 13. STATE

14. PERNIT MO. 18 EixvaTIONS (Show whether D2, XY, €, ete.)
43-013-31167 5921' (Ungr GL) - Duchesne Utah
16 Check Appropriate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Repont, or Other Data

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SOUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:
TEST WATER SBUT-OFF - POLI. OR ALTER CASING WATER SEDT-OFF REPAIKING WELL
FRACTORE TREAY M OLTIFLE COMPIETR ' FRACTURE TAEATMENT ALTERING CABING
SMWOOT OR ACIDILE ARAHDON® » SBOOTING OR ACTDIZING ABARDONMENT®
BEPAIR WELL CRAXCE PLANS (otver) Monthly Drilling Report X
Norz: Report results of multiple completion ‘on Well
(Otber) ompletion or Recompletion Report ané Log form.)
37. DESCRIBL I'ROFOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state al) pertivent details, snd zive pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting an
pro work. 1f well Is directionslly ‘drmed. give subsurface Jocations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers apd sopes perti

»ent to this work.) ®
1

MONTHLY DRILLING REPORT FOR JULY 1986

DATE DAY DRLG DEPTH OPERATION )

7-1-86 12 6903' Drilling B-3/4" Hole 7-24-86 35 11656"
7-2-86 13 7214" " 7-25-86 36 11812" "
7-3-86 14 7652 v 7-26-86 37 11947 "
7-4-86 15 8060’ " 7-27-86 38 12009" "
7-5-86 16 8312° " 7-28-86 39 12202 "
7-6-86 Y, 8616’ " 7-29-86 40 12277 "
7-7-86 18 8860" - 7-30-86 41 12424° "
7-8-86 19 9060" " 7-31-86 42 12616 "
7-9-86 20 9430" . _ :
7-10-86 21 9725 "
7-11-86 22 9771" "
7-12-86 23 9984 "
7-13-86 24 10090* "
. 7-18-86 2% 10332 -
. 7-15-86 26 10532" .
. 7-16-86 27 10634’ v
7-17-86 28 10809° "
7-18-86 29 10980" "
7-19-8¢ 30 11080" -
7-20-86 3 11235" v
7-21-86 3 11363' i
7-22-86 33 13441 " _
7-23-86 3 11567° o : _ - _ —

~ <7i74¥4444 - -Eng.Technician , parm _ 5-8-86

(This space for Federal or State eftice Bos)

18. I beredy certity

DATE

° APPROVED BY ' TITLE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

‘S;Q Instructions onﬁeuhc Side



Lo
PINY el 3

L ]

PRI

SUTNIT

O UNIIED SDIHIAITLES o
DEPARTMENZRDF THE INTERIOR vern'ss

de)

IN TRIRIAC
furiructions

(R

0T EEE Ty e R T N W
Budzet Joreaw No. £2-R3424.
O LEASE LISICNATION AND BERIAL KO.

ATL®
on re

GEOIWBICAL SURVEY 14-20-H62-1704 /
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS B e T e

(Do pot use this

form for proposals te drill or to Seepen or plug back to a different reservolr.
Use “"APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposala.)

3. 7. UNIT ACREEMENT NAME
?-l:'.x. :‘:u. oTHER N/ A
2. KAME OF OPEBRATOR 8. FARM OR LEASE NAMK
BOW VALLEY PETROLEUM, INC. Ute
3. ADDAESS OF OPIRiTOR . 9. WELL MO.
P.0. DRAWER 130, ROOSEVELT, UTAH. 84066 2. 3422'
4. ::gu;za::;‘:l#&ﬁ;;:«;rt location clearly and in fceord;nce with any State requirements.® 19. FIELD AND FOOL, OR wxpcgr
At surface Bluebell -

: " 1223' FSL, 1957' FWL, SE SW

11. 3xC., T. R, M, OR BLX. AND
SUAYEY OR ARRA

Sec.34, TIN, R2W

14. PERNIT NO. 15, RLEVATIONS (Show whether Dr, BY, CR, ete) 12. COUNTY OR PARISH] 18. STATE
43-013-31167 5921' ungr GL :
9 Duchesne Utah
1e Check Appropriate Box To Indicate Nature of Nofice, Report, or Other Data
NOTICB OF INTENTION TO: SORSEQUENT REIFORT OF:

TEST WATER BRUT-OFF . PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SRDT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAY MULTIPLE COMPIETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CABING

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON® : SBOOTING OR ACTDIZING ABANDONMEXRT®

arraix wiLk CHANCE PLANS (Other) Monthly -Dr1lling Report

NoTte: Report results of multiple completion ‘on Well

(Other) i ((.omplet!on or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIRL P'ROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and -.-}ve pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

pro work.
nent to this work.) ®
1

If well

is directionally drilled, give subsurf,

MONTHLY DRILLING REPORT FOR AUGUST 1986

act Jocations and measnred and true vertical depths for all markers and zopes perti-

DATE DAY DRLG DEPTH OPERATION
8-1-86 43 12640° Drilling B-3/4" Hole.
8-2-86 44 12741" "
8-3-86 45 12842° b
8-4-86 46 12962' "
8-5-86 47 13038* "
8-6-86 48 13216° "
8-7-86 49 13340’ "
8-8-86 50 13432' "
8-9-86 51 13580° »
8-10-86 52 13690' " »
8-11-86 53 13766’ “
8-12-86 54 13920' " SEP 17 1986
8-13-86 55 14053’ "
8-14-86 56 14100' Drilling & Logging. . i
8-15-86 57 14100' Logging.
8-16-86 58 14100' Washing & Reaming Hole. O’LD(‘SV'S‘ON OF
8-17-86 59 14100' Running & Cementing 7" Csg.
- 8-18-86 60 14100 Logging (Temp & CBL). .GAS & MINING
8-19-86 61 14100' "
8-20-86 62 14100’ Squeeze Cementing 7" Csg. .
8-21-86 63 14100' Fishing Stuck DP.
8-22-86 64 14100’ Run CBL & Drilling Cement.
8-23-86 65 14100° Squeeze & Spot Cementing.
8-24-86 66 14100' "
8-25-86 67 14100' "
8-26-86 68 14100' "
8-27-86 69 14100' WOC & Driliing Cement. ~
8-28-86 70 14103° Drilling 6" Hole. =
8-29-86 71 14165"' "
8-30-86 72 14273' "
8-31-86 73 14363' "
18. I beredy certity 4 correct - -
SIGNET = orrrxe _ ENg. Technician DATE 9-12-86
(Tbis space for Federal or State office use) . ' ! ‘
. . . R
APPROVED BY i TITLE DATE |

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL,

IF ANY:

. .

*See Instructions onﬁcnbc Side




SVLMIT IN TRILICATL®
tOtber Iuriructions on re

DEPARTMENZOF THE INTERIOR vere wgriey 4 3
GEOIJBICAL SURVEY —"-U-i-f.fi‘»—
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

wse this form fer proposals te &rill or to éecpen or plug back to a different reservolr. Ute Tribe
(Do not Use ~APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-— for such proposala) :

Fopm 2-3%0 UNIITED STAILES

SMuy bl Hudzet Vureasu No. 42-R142¢4.

. LEASE DII'ICNAYIOK AND SLRIAL KO.

14-20-H62-1704

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOYTEL OR TRISE NAME

(1}

1. 7. UNIT sCGREEMENT NaAME

3.
:tl:u. :‘:.u. OTRER ! N / A
2. NMAXE OF OFERATOR : % 8 FALM O LEASE NAME
BOW VALLEY PETROLEUM, INC. UTE

$. wxLL NO.

§. ADDREZSS OF OPERATOR

P.0. DRAWER 130, ROOSEVELT, UTAH 84066 = miyiSiONOF o 2-3472

4. 1ocarion or wrLL (Report location clearly and in accordubce with any State ir S 10. FIELD 4XD POOL, OR WILDCAY
See al30 space 17 below.) , mt CTA%‘& M?N!NG B.] UEbE] 1 - Wasatch

At .nrhee .
: - . ’ 11, sszc. %, &, M., OF BLK. AND
1223' FSL, 1957' FWL, SE SW SURYEY OR ARBA
_ | Sec.34, TIN, RW  _
14. PERMIT NO. 18, ELXVATIONS (SSow whether DF, BT, CR, ete.) 12, COUNTY OR PARISN] 13. sTATE
43-013-31167 N ' - 5921' Ung GL Lo Duchesne Utah
16. : Check Appropriate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
FOTICB OF INTENTIGN YO SUBSEQUENT REFORT OF 2
TEST WATER SEUT-OFF ' . PDLL OR ALTER CASIVG WATER SHOT-OFP ACPAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE . FRACTORE TREATMENT : ALTIRING CASING
SBOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON® ' . SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT®
AEPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS omery Honthly Drilling Report X
) : 1t1p letion ‘on W
(Other) N e or Recowmplerion Report and Log form)

. DESCRISE IFROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and zive pertinent dates, Including estimated date of starting an
1 proposed work. lf well is directionally drilled, give subsurface Jocations nn:' measured ,n:d true vertical depths for all markers and sopnes pertz

nent to this work.) ®
MONTHLY DRILLING REPORT FOR SEPTEMBER 1986

DATE DAY DRLG DEPTH OPERATION
9-01-86 74 14463’ Drilling 6 " Hole.
9-02-86 75 14547 "

9-03-86 75 14602° "
9-04-86 77 14712" N
9-05-86 78 14822° "
9-06-86 79 14928' "

© - 9-07-86 80 15030' "
9-08-86 81 15124" "
9-09-86 82 15203’ "
9-10-86 83 15294' "
9-11-86 84 15382' "
9-12-86 &5 15470" "
9-13-86 &6 15566° : "

- 9-14-86 &7 .15656' "
9-15-86 &8 15764' "
9-16-86 &9 15864 "
9-17-86 €0 15959' "

. 9-18-86 g1 16000’ Reached TD & Logging.
9-19-86 92 16000° Logging.
9-20-86 a3 16000’ Running 5" Liner.
9-21-86 94 16000° Cementing Liner.
9-22-86 95 16000’ Drilling Cement. _—
9-%3-86 a6 16000 LD DP & DC.

9

-24-86 497 . 16000’ RD Rotary Tools. Released
- Rig at 5:00 p.m.

K T baedy certify fhat the foregos T S — - =

105 ehglle FC T  mimz=__Eng. Technician pars . 10-7-86

(Th1s spuce for Yederal or State ofice use) , o - - .
* APPROVED BY ____ ' . TITIR __ —_— _ DATE _

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANX:

.- .- ..

*Gee Instructions on Reverse Side




Porr» $-330
(Rev. 5~83)

U

D STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

SUBMIT IN DUPLQ@
Se

structions on
reverse side)

Form approved.
Budget Bureau No. 42-R355.5.

501

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND

SERIAL NO.

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY

14-20-H62-1704

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG*

. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

Ute Tribe

Ta. TYPE OF WELL: WELL WELL DRY J Other 7. CNIT AGREEMENT NAME
b. TYPE OF COMPLETION: - N/A
{\;%ZL g%‘k“ D L’i“' §’;5§2 g:;?:—'g, Other S. FARM OR LEASE NAME
2. NAME OF OPERATOR UTE
Bow Valley Petroleum, Inc. - |78 wiL %o,

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR

P.0. Drawer 130, Roosevelt, Utah 84066

2-3872

] °10. FIELD AND POOL, OB WILDCAT

Sy To oy

|
4, LOCATION OF WELL (Keport location clearly and in accordance with any Siate requirerﬂeﬁts)' TS07

1957" FWL, SE SW

At surface

1223" FSL,

'B]uebé]] - Wasatch

11. SEC., T., R, M., OR BLOCK AND BURVEY
OR AREA

At top prod. interval reported below same
Sec.34, TIN, R2W
At total depth same
14. PERMIT NO. DATE ISSUED 12. COUNTY OR 13. STATE
PARISH
43-013-31167 | 6-18-86 Duchesne Utah

15. DATE SPUDDED

6-19-86

16, DATE T.D. REACHED

8-18-86

1

17. PATE coMPL. (Ready to prod.)

1-2-86

18. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, GR, ETC.}* 19. ELEV. CASINGHEAD

5921' Ungraded GL

20. TOTAL DEFTH, MD & TVD 21, PLUG, BACK T.D., MD & TVD 22. IF MULTIPLE COMPL., 23. INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS
, . HOW MANY® DRILLED BY
16,000 15990 — ALL | None

24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S8), OF THIS COMPLETION—TOP, BOTTOM, hAME (MD AND TVD)* ' 25. WAS DIRECTIONAL
SURVEY MADE
Upper Wa % tch Perf, ﬂ’ ,% -150 1
I. ‘i 7S n.r¢ L 56(” ?I NO
28, TYPE EL C AND OTEMR J06S lfﬁ\ l‘ / 27. WAS WELL CORED
SD/DSNL, MSQ#F%, D CSNG. LSDT Runs 1 & 2 No
28. CASING RECORD (Report all strings set in well)
CASING BIZE WEIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED
9-5/8" 40# 3200' 124" 980 sx BJ lite
il
7 29, 32# 14075’ 8-3/4" 1120 sx 'H'+Spoté&Sqz
610 sx 'G' & 'H'
29. LINER RECORD 30. TUBING RECORD
SIZE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACES CEMENT*® SCREEN (MD) SI1ZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)
5" 13793! 15990 290 sx'H' 2-7/8" 14082.50' 14082.50'
31, PDRFORATION RECORD (Interval, size and number) 82, ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.
DEPTH INTERVAL (MD) AMOUNT AND EIND OF MATERIAL USED
(see attached) 15094-15582 16,000 cal 15% HC1 acid
33.* PRGDUCTION
DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD (Flowing, gas lift, pumping—esize and type of pump) WELL STATUS (Producing or
11-2-86 Progbc1na
DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SIZE PROD’N. FOR OIL—BBL. GAS——MCF. WATER—BBL. GAS-OIL RATIO
TEST PERIOD
11-4-86 24 25 — | 716 | 247 | o0 345
FLOW, TUBING PRESS. | CASING PRESSURE | CALCULATED OIL~-BBL. GAS~—MCP. W ATER—BBL. OIL GRAVITY-API (CORR.)
24-HOUR RATE
700 — | l | 40.5
84. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, used for fuel, vented, €tc.) TEST WITNESSED BY 94
Sold to Gary Energy Claude Crozier Q
85, LIST OF ATTACHMENTS (] )
Perforation Detail, Form 0GC-8X i

38. I hereby certify that the fore,

! >
MITHELFEME LHAM

e 7vas

TITLE

Eng. Technician

ing and attached information 18 complete and correct as determined from all available records

11-21-86

DATE

*(See Instructions and Spaces for Additional Data on Reverse Side)
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Bow Valley Petroleum Inc.

- 15882
' 15880
15873
15870
15823
15818
15800
15738
15732
15729
15663
15647
15646
15612
15583

15567
15565
15555
15553
15551
15545
15541
15523
15477
15463
15456
15416
15396
15394
15392

UTE 2-3472

PERFORATIONS
1st Set

15390
15389
15373
15371
15365
15340
15338
15329
15316
15314
15307
15305
15303
15293
15291

A1l perfs with 3-3/8" power-pac

csg guns, 3 SPF.

15264
15262
15260
15259
15230
15208
15202
15192
15190
15188
15180
15169
15163
15157
15155

15150
15142
15136
15133
15125
15117
15102
15094

Total Feet 68
Total Perfs 204



-«

¥

15057
15055
15047
15043
15024
15004
15002
14997
14989
14985
14975
14971
14967
14951
14949
14945
14940
14932
14927
14922

(Bow Valley Exploration (U.S.) Inc.

UTE 2-3422

2nd Set of Perforations per M.G. Wagner -

14915
14907
14899
14871
14869
14865
14862
14852
14850
14811
14809
14807
14804
14803
14799
14797
14795
14784
14782
14778

3 JSPF, 120 deg

phased

3-1/8" c¢sg guns

14771
14762
14751
14749
14734
14711
14708
14704
14701
14699
14691
14683
14660
14655
14645
14642
14626
14609
14607
14584

Total

14582
14580 .
14522
14514 -
14512
14480
14478
14470
14465
14431
14424
14418
14397
14395
14260
14253
14246
14236
14234
14223

87 feet, 261 shots

ey

P
r
L

14221
14197
14195
14183
14146
14139
14121



FORM OGC-8-X . .

STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESCURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING .. . -
4241 State Office Build T ey e
Salt Lake City, UT 8114 = ©° "0 V-

*REP(RT OF WATER ENCOUNTERED DURING DRILLING*'-: "/

Well Name & Number UTE TRIBE 2-3472
Operator BOW VALLEY PETROLEUM, INC. Address P-0. DRAYER 130, ROOSEVELT, UTAH
Contractor CACHUMA DRILLING COMPANY Address  vEain EaG sa078 o
Location SE 1/4 SW  1/4 Sec. 34 T, IN R, 2! County DUCHESNE
Water Sands
Depth Volume Quality

From To Flow Rate or Head Fresh or Salty
1. NONE ENCOUNTERED
2.
3.
4.
5.

“(ContInue on reverse side IiII necessary)

Formation Tops

Greenriver 7040', TGR-3 9927', Wasatch Red Beds 11250', Base of Red Beds 14100’
Remarks

NOTE: (a) Report on this form as provided for in Rule C-20, General Rules
and Regulations and Rules of Practice and Procedure.

(b) If a water analysis has been made of the above reported zone,
please forward a copy along with this form.
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{(Rev. 5-68)

Ur\.ED STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
GEOLOGICAL SURVEY

SUBMIT IN DUPL.Z'
(SeS¥er in-

structions on
reverse side)

Form approved
Budget Bureau I\o 42-R355.6

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO

14-20-H62-1704

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG*

fa. TYPE OF WELL: oIl GAS D
WELL WELL DRY Other
b. TYPE OF COMPLETION:
NEW WORK DEEP- PLUG DIFF.
WELL OVER EN BACK RESVR. Other

2.

NAME OF OPERATOR

Bow Valley Petroleum, Inc.

3.

ADDRESS OF OPERATOR

At surface 1223' FSL .

At top prod. interval reported below

At total depth same

1957 FWL, SE SW

same S

8, IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

Ute Tribe

7. UNIT AGREEMEXT NAME

* N/A

§. FARM OR LEASE NAME

UTE

178, weLL No,

2-3472

10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

Bluebell - Wasatch

11. SEC., T., R., M., OK BLOCK AND SURVEY
OR AREA

Sec.34, TIN, R2W

14. PERMIT NO. DATE ISSUED 12. ggglh‘s'r; OR 13. STATE
43-013-31167 | 6-18-86 Duchesne Utah

19. ELEV. CASINGHEAD

15. DATE SPUDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED | 17. DATE COMPL. (Ready to prod.) | 1§ ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, GE, ETC.)*
6-19-86 8-18-86 11-2-86 5921"' Ungraded GL ---
20. TOTAL DEPTH, MD & TVD 21, PLUG, BACK T.D., MD & TVD 22. IF MULTIPLE COMPL,, 23. INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS
. ) HOW MANY? DRILLED BY
16,000 15990 —_ | ALL | None

24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION—TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AXND TVD)* [ 25. WAS DIRECTIONAL
SURVEY MADE
Upper Wasatch Perfs 14121'-15057' l NG
26. TYPE ELECTBIC AND OTHER'LOGS RUN -~ o 27. WAS WELL CORED
SD/D§NL MSG/FF DIGL, CSNG LSDT Runs 1 & 2 No
28. CASING RECORD (Report all strings set in well)
CASING SIZE WEIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED
9-5/8" 404 3200 124" 980 sx BJ lijte
7" 29, 32# 14075’ 8-3/4" 1120 sx 'H'+Spot&Sqz
610 sx 'G' & 'H'
29. LINER RECORD 30. TUBING RECORD
BIZE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACES CEMENT* SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPTH BET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)
5" 13793’ 15990' 290 sx'H' 2-7/8" | 14082.50' 14082.50°
31. PERFORATION RECORD (Interval, size and number) 2. ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.
DEPTH INTERVAL (MD) AMOUNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL TSED
(see attached) 15094-15582 16,000 oal 15% HC1 acid
33.* PRODUCTION

DATE FIRST PRODUCTION

11-2-86

PRODUCTION METHOD (Flowing, gas lift, pumping—size and type of pump)

WELL STATUS (Producing or

Progbc1nn

DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SIZE PROD'N. FOR 0O1L—BBL. GAS-—MCF. WATER—BBL, GAS-0OIL RATIO
TEST PERIOD

11-4-86 24 25 — | 716 | 247 0 | 345

¥LOW. TUBING PRESS. CASING PRESSURE CALCULATED OIL—BBL. GAS-—MCF. WATER—BBL. OIL GRAVITY-APL (CORB.)
24-HOUR RATE

700 — | | 40.5

34, DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, used for fuel, vented, etc.) ] TEST WITNESSED BY
Sold to Gary Energy i Claude Crozier
35. LIST QOF ATTACHMENTS
Perforation Detail, Form 0GC-8X

36. I hereby certify that the fore,

! =
MITHEEEET MELHAM

pd

TITLE

e e Eng. Technician

ing and attacbed information is complete and correct as determined from all avallable records

11-21-86

DATE

*(See Instructions and Spaces for Additional Data on Reverse Side)
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Bow Valley Petroleum Inc.

S 4

15882
15880
15873
15870
15823
15818
15800
15738
15732
15729
15663
15647
15646
15612
15583

15567
15565
15555
15553
15551
15545
15541
15523
15477
15463
15456
15416
15396
15394
15392

UTE 2-3472

PERFORATIONS
1st Set

15390
15389
15373
15371
15365
15340
15338
15329
15316
15314
15307
15305
15303
15293
15291

A11 perfs with 3-3/8" power-pac

¢sg guns, 3 SPF.

15264
15262
15260
15259
15230
15208
156202
16192
15190
15188
15180
15169
15163
15157
15155

15150 -
15142 -
15136
15133
15125
15117
15102
15094

Total Feet 68
Total Perfs 204



-

¥

(Bow Valley Exploration (U.S.) Inc.

15057
15055
15047
15043
15024
15004
15002
14997
14989
14985
14975
14971
14967
14951
14949
14945
14940
14932
14927
14922

UTE 2-3472

2nd Set of Perforations per M.G. Wagner

14915
14907
14899
14871
14869
14865
14862
14852
14850
14811
14809
14807
14804
14803
14799
14797
14795
14784
14782
14778

3 JSPF, 120 deg

phased

3-1/8" csg guns

14771
14762
14751
14749
14734
14711
14708
14704
14701
14699
14691
14683
14660
14655
14645
14642
14626
14609
14607
14584

Total

14582
14580
14522
14514
14512
14480
14478
14470
14465
14431
14424
14418
14397
14395
14260
14253
14246
14236
14234
14223

87 feet, 261 shots

ST

14221
14197
14195
14183
14146
14139
14121

Fip oo
LDy ;



® ®

STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES |

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING -
4241 State Office Building BRI T
Salt Lake City, UT 8411 S e e

*REPRT OF WATER ENCOUNTERED DURING DRILLING*

Well Name & Nurber UTE TRIBE 2-3472
Operator _ BOW VALLEY PETROLEUM, INC. Address P-0. DRAYER 130, ROOSEVELT, UTAH
Contractor CACHUMA DRILLING COMPANY Address  pEminL uTaa sa078 o
Location SE_1/4 SH  1/4 Sec. 34 T. IN R, 21  County DUCHESNE
Water Sands
Depth Volume Quality

From To Flow Rate or Head Fresh or Salty
1. NONE ENCOUNTERED
2.
3.
4,
5.

(Continue on reverse side if necessary)

Formation Tops

Greenriver 7040', TGR-3 9927', Wasatch Red Beds 11250', Base of Red Beds 14100’
Remarks

NOTE: (a) Report on this form as provided for in Rule C-20, General Rules
and Regulations and Rules of Practice and Procedure.

(b) If a water analysis has been made of the above reported zone,
please forward a copy along with this form.



Form approved.
Budget Bureau No. 10040135

\ .
Form 3160-58 Uf “-D STATES SUBMIT IN TR{"‘(‘ATB' Expires August 31, 19858

(November 1983) (Other flpstruct) J L
5. LEASE DEBIONATION AND BBAIAL NWO.

AFomerly 9-331) DEPARTM ; F THE |NTER|OR verse gide)

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 14-20-H62-1704
6. IF INDIAN, AL E OR TRIBE Na
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS T eyt
e not we thi tegm for gropensl fo ) AT Rl propeae 7T T te Tri209:3
T 7. UNIT AGREEMENT KAME
wELL wrLL OTBER . n/a
2. NaAME OF OPERATOR L 8. FARM OR LEABE NAME
BOW VALLEY PETROLEUM, INC. o, UTE
9. wWaLL No.

(%

8. 4ADDRESE OF OPERATOR

P.0. DRAWER 130, ROOSEVELT, UTAH 84066 B 2-3472

i T 1ocaTion OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance witb any Sute‘;gq?ggmppgg.ﬂ = 10. PIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
See nluo space 17 below.) Hy o i W _ .
‘At surface S CAD S VLR i Bluebell - Wasatch
, , R 1i. sac, ., 5., M., Ok BLK. AND
1223"' FSL, 1957' FWL, SE SW SURYBY O ARBA
Sec.34, TIN, R2Y
14. PERMIT NO. 15. BLEVATIONS (Show whether DF, XT, Gk, etc.) 12. COUNTY OR PARIRH| 18. STATE
43-013-31167 5921' Ung GL Duchesne Utah
1c. Check Appropriate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF !

TEST WATEER SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATEE SHUT-OFP REPAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CABING
SHOOT OB ACIDIZE ABANDON® SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT®
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANE {Other) Amend Item# 32,33/ Form9-330
(Notk : Report_results of multiple completion on Well
(QOther) Completion or Recowapletion Beport and Log form.)

1~7. DESCRIDF PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONE (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and gones perti-

nent to this work.) *

Please amend Item# 32 on Form 9-330 (completion report) dated
11-21-86 as follows:

Additional Depth Interval Shot -- 14121'-15057',
Above interval was perforated on 10-30-86 and
as of this date has not been acidized.

On Item #33, production method was omitted and should have been
shown as "Flowing".

18. I bereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct

J-—a , . s
P it DB A telernr oo ENG.Technician pate _2-4-87

(This space for Federal or State office use)

DATE

APPROVED BY TITLE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the
United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.



i ~ l
coMPANY: A o) jjﬂ,},b,u - UT ACCOUNT # M ({30 SUSPENSE DATE:/(:L,];H, 1587
‘ B | . [

i TELEPHONE CONTACT DOCUMENTATION

: CONTACT NAME:D,wu/J D ding

" ; T

e

CONTACT TELEPHONE NO.: 1-303- %49-914]

. susdcT: 4,0y Complition Repod 1, ql. 3] Jaes 307

e o

(Use attachments If necessary)

RESULTS: QJJ Lt bnding LJCR

(Use attachments if necessary)

CONTACTED 3};/’—¥%\lellu41@&

DATE: [-07-87. v

NIRTERL




FLCR NP

6705-108
Rev. 6-84

042508

AMENDED

CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY
' OF : -

GW PETROLEUM INC.

The Department of Business Regulation, Division of Corporations and Commercial Code, pursuant
to the . Utah Business Corporation  Act, hereby issues an Amended Certizina of Authority to

GW PETROLEUM INC., formerly BOW VALLEY PETROLEUM INC.

to transact business in the State of Utah.

File No. #79959 D @EHW]
O | | &EAPR 27 19871 Ll))

DIVISION OF
OlL. GAS & MINING

Dated this 23xd day of
=) 0 1= ' AU A.D.19 . 8B7....

-

Director, Division of Corpo ations and
Commercial Code

iy




. 6705-36
o _ : ' Rev. 6-84
Filing Fee: $25.00 7 File Duplicate Originals
: ‘ T - APPLICATIONFOR 1537 FE0 23 PH 2:28
~ R AMENDED CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY
e <o . OF
' 3 %-C - Bow VALLEY PETROLEUM INC.

35' O O (corporate name)

To the Division of Corporations and Commercial Code
State of Utah o . S

Pursuant to the provisions of Section 16-10-14 of the Utah Business Corporation Act, the
undersigned corporation hereby applies foran Amended Certificate of Authority to transactbusiness
Utah, and for that purpose submits the following statement: _ :

FIRST: A Certificate of Authdrity was issued to the corporation by your office on

December 19, .19 78 _ . authorizing it to transact business in your State.

SECOND: The corporate na‘me of the corporation has been changed to
GN PETROLEUM INC.

THIRD: The corporation will use the changed name hereafter in Utah. .

FOURTH: It desires to pursue in the transaction of businesss in Utah other or additional -
purposes than those set forth in its prior Application for a Certificate of Authority, as follows:

No change

Dated February 3 , 19 87

Notes: 1. If the corporate name has not been changed, insert “No Change”.

2. If no other or additional purposes are proposed, insert “NO Change".

Under penailties of perjury,-we declare that this application for Amended Certiticate of
Authority has been exmined by us and is, to the best of our knowledge and belief, true, correct and
complete.

Send completed forms to:

STATE OF UTAH
Department of Business Regulation G W PETROLEUM INC. .

Div. of Corporations & Commercial Code
160 E. 300 South / P.O. Box 5801

BRI )a
Qe sEW g Iy
APR 27 1987 i.)

DIVISION QF
OiL, GAS & MINING

}
(exaclcorpoghte name)

By / X

Secreiasy-of Assistant Secretary



‘ : : ' DOGM 56-64-2
'f an equal opportumity employse
a UTAH :
. V NATURAL RESOURCE!

Oit. Gas & Mining

355 West North Temple, 3 Triad Center, Suite 350, Sait Lake City, Ut 5 5
84180-1203.8{801-538-5340) Page of
B MONTHLY OIL AND GAS PRODUCTION REPORT
Operator name and address:'
®BOW VALLEY PETROLEUM, INC. Utah Account No. — NO130
1675 BROADWAY, SUITE 2100
DENVER co 80202 Report Period (Month/Year) — 3/ 87
ATTN: JUDY WILSON
Amended ReportD

TWell Name i b o “;| Producing | Days | Production Volume .
APi  Number Entity Location | Zone Oper | Oil (BBL) Gas (MSCF) Water (BBL)
\(WESLEY BASTIAN FEE #1 :

h301310A96 ooghz 01s 01w 8 WSTC
FRNTGHT #1 i T
4301330184 01090 025 03w”28 WSTC
MYRIN RANCH #1 . 7

301330176 01091 ozs 03W 20 WSTC
DUSTIN. #1 o o e
4301330122 01092 ozs 03W 22 | WSTC
HANSEN #71.- i
h301330161 0109
PRESCOTT A=35Z1 - emr i 7 S
h3oh731173 01h25 OlN OIW 35 | WSTC
&3 T:CARRELL #1. - 7 70
431330158 02307 025 03W 27 | WSTC
D.R. LONG 2-T9ATE o . . .
k304731470 09505 015 O1E 19 | GRRV
"OBERHANSLY 2-37ZT . =7 7. |
4301330970 09725 O1IN 01w 31 | wWsTC
0 "MOON. 2-262Z1 S

WSTC

"4,304731480 10135 OIN WSTC
~(MAGDALENE PAPDOPULOS 2-3KTE
‘4304730683 10610 01S O1E 3 GRRV

" JESSEN #2-TLAL. T
~ 1301331160 10611 015 WSTC
£ UTE TRIBAL #2=3422

4301337167 10668 OIN

WSTC

TOTAL

Comments (attach separate sheet if necessary)

I have reviewed this report and certify the information to be accurate and complete. Date

Telephon
orized signature elephone

PLEASE COMPLETE FORMS IN BLACK INK .




Form approved.

Forn 31062 ¢ - UBMIT IN e Budpet Burcau No. 1004-017¢
(Noves et 19835 UN..TATES Some: In!ltr:(.-lt‘l?r:‘ ____Expires Aupust 31, 196% -
(Former)y G-331) DEPARTMEN § (.,. THE lNTERIOR verse aide) 0. LEASE DESIGNATION AND BBRIAL KO,
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 14-20-H62-1704 PO
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS O fr o auloTIRe on Ty Tt
D t this form for proponals to arlll or to deepen of plug back to s different reservolir.
o not use this form Lo B R ATION FOR PERMIT—"" for such proposals.) UTE 090 1
3 7. URIT AGREENENT NANE
(335 GAB
wELL @ wELL D OTHEE _ N/A
2 NaME OF OPEEATOR 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME
BOW VALLEY PETROLEUM, INC. UTE
3 "APDRESE OF OPEBATOR 9. waBLL NO.
P.0O. 'DRAWER 130, ROOSEVELT, UTAH 84066 o 2-3422
4 TioCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
See alsn space 17 below.) .
At surface Bluebell = Wasatch
' ' i1. suc, T., k., M., OR BLK. AND
1223' FSL, 1957' FWL, SE SW | RS,
Sec. 34, TIN, R2W
14. PERMIT NO. 16. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, XT, GE, etc.) 12. COUNTY Ok PARISH]| 18. 8TATS
'
43-013-31167 5921' Ung GL Duchesne Utah
1e Check Appropricie Box To Indicaie Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
PP por,
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT RNPORT OF ©
TEST WATEE SEUT-OFF PCLL OR ALTER CASING WATEE BHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL
FEACTURL TREAT MULTIPLE COMPI.ETE FEACTURE TREATMENT | ALTERING CABING
§HOOT OB ACIDIZE ABANDON? SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING | X ABANDONMENT®
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (otner) _Straddle thief zone
o (NOTE : Report results of multiple completion op Well
{Other) Completion or Recorapletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESTRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONE (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposecihwork. l'»If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and gones perti-
nent to this work.) *

Bow Valley completed work on well Feb.12, 1987 through Feb.28, 1987 as follows:
1. Acidized Wasatch intervals 14121'-15057' with 14,500 gallons 15% HCL
containing additives.
2. Swabbed well down after acidizing.
3. Ran Gamma-Ray Temp Tracer Log to determine thief zone.

4. Set straddle packers to isolate thief zone (14465'-14552');
Baker 32FAB30 @ 14442' and Baker 32FAB30 @ 14540'.

5. Set Baker retrievamatic production packer @ 13891'.
6. Install downhole hydraulic pump in well @ 13680°'.

Average production before workover:  130.7 BOPD, 0 BWPD, 110 MCFD.
Average production after workover: 392.5 BOPD, 124.1 BWPD, 226 MCED.

o Technician DATE 4-6-87

(This space for Federal or State office use)

; : gﬁ}
\PR 08 1987 &

DIVISION OF

ING
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to m@&ho%&&amgn‘z‘m or agency of the
United States any {aise, Jictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

APPROVED BY TITLE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

i

*See Instructions on Reverse Side



Formn, approved.

- p .
Fon. n60-& 2~ . . Budgcet Burcau Ne. 1004-0]12%
(T:-'n\'cwhm 1083) UN. TATES ?é)(l;‘e‘rnll}uhtr&?;” - EXP”OS—AUEUM 31. 198°
Foraerly 9—331) DEPARTMENT © THE INTERIOR verse sige) . LEASE DESIGNATION AND BBAIAL -oIb
1
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT eo0rer-1704 PO
SUNDRY NOT'CES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEER OR TRIBE NANE
) i f Is to drill or to deepen or piug back to s different reservolr. 42 10 7
(Do not use thir fol';: "?ArP rl(‘,lpg.:er;oﬁ F‘rOR OPEROLHT——p"' for such proposals.) UTE
- 7. UNKIT AGREEXENT NANE
o1L GAB
win B W O orse N/A
27 KaME OF OPERATOR 8. PARM OR LEABE NAME
BOW VALLEY PETROLEUM, INC. UTE
3. ADDREBS OF OPERATOR 9. waLL NO.
. P.0O. DRAWER 130, ROOSEVELT, . 2-3472
4 LocatioN or wELL (Report lecation clearly and ib accordance with apy: ] 'YO. piELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
iee also spuce 17 below.) £ -
t surface Blucbell - Wasatch
"1 sac., T., K., M., OR BLK. AND
. \ e SURVEY OR ARE4
1223' FSL, 1957' FWL, SE SW
_BHSINNOE Sec. 34, TIN, R2W
14. PERMIT NO. 16 BiEvaTions (Show whether DF, KT, OR,_etcy/ ' vV (RIEY W70 12. COUNTY OB PAEISH| 18. STATE
1' Ung GL Duchesne Utah
1. Check Approprate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSFQUENT REFORT OF @
TEST WATEE BEUT-OFF PCLL OR ALTER CASING WATEE SEUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL
FEACTURL TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FEACTUEE TREATMENT ALTERING CABING
S8HOOT OB ACIDIZE ABANDON® SBOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT® -
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANE (Other) NTL~-2B Water D:Lsposal Method X
(NOTE : Report results of multiple complet W
(Other) Completion or Recomapletion Bepl:)rt lndplfogofox?;.) el

17. DESCKIBE I'ROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONE (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting an
proposed work. 1f well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locativns and meastred and true vertical depths for all markers and sones xpel’t-

nent to this work.) ¢

NTL~2B
Application for Produced Water Disposal Method

All produced water from this lease is trucked to Max Chapoose's
disposal pond located in Section 27, TIN, R2W, Neola, Duchesne
County, Utah.

1. Depth & Formation of producing interval: 14121'-15057'.
2. Average daily water production: 130 BPD.

3. A current water analysis of produced water from this lease
is attached.

rrrLe __End. Technician pare _ 4-15-87

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*Gee Instructions on Reverse Side

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department ur agency of the
Unites States any {alse, fictitious or frauduient statements or representations &8s to any matter within its jurisdiction.



®e 0

b4
A Procter & Gamble Co. g?ﬁggi; 2/98872-3011 g&ﬁﬁéﬁ%ﬁﬁé = TWX.: 910/360-5100
(U.S.): 800/527-2510 (TX.) 800/442-6261
WATER ANALYSIS REPORT
COMPANY Bow Valley/Great Western ADDRESs _Roosevelt, UT. 84066 pATE:__ 4-09-87
© SOURCE Ute 2-3422 DATE sampLED 2709787 __ ANALYSIS NO
Ansiysie M/ (pom) | x R
B _— g"‘i i wlala =
2. H.S (Qualitative) 0 4 APR L7 1E8S
3. Specific Gravity 1.005 OIISION OF
4. Dissolved Solids O GAS & RMINING
5. Suspended Solids
6. Anaerobic Bacterial Count C/MI
7. Methyl Orange Alkalinity (CaCO:s) 610
8. Bicarbonate (HCO:) HCOs 744 161 12 HCOs
9. Chlorides (Cl) Cl 4,248 +35.5__120 cl
10. Sulfates (SO.) SO« 0 s48___ 0 SO«
11. Calcium (Ca) Ca 48 +20 Ca
12. Magnesium (Mg) Mg 7 422" Mg
13. Total Hardness (CaCO,) 150
14. Total lron (Fe) 5.0
15. Barium (Qualitative)
16. Phosphate Residuals
i s e PROBABLE MINERAL COMPOSITION
Compound Equiv.Wt. X Meq/1 = Mg/
Ca (HCOs): 81.04 2 162
ca HCO, Ca SO. 68.07
T CaCl: 55.50
Mg _» SO. Mg (HCO:): 73.17 :5 36.5
/ Mg SO. 60.19
Na —> Mg Cla 47.62
Saturation Values Distilied Water 20°C NaHCOs 84.00 9.5 798
CaCOs 13 Mg/ Na:SO. 71.03 0 0
CaSO.- 2H:0 2,090 Mg/} NaCl 58.46 120 7,015
Mg COs 103 Mg/l

REMARKS




DOGM Form 3
May 5, 1987

DEPARTMENT OF NATUR { i { BLM COPY
‘ , DIVISION OF OiL, GAS,} MINING " S Usia% SERIONATION ANB BBRIAL Xo.
0CT 26 1989 14200621704

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS %&%ﬁs

{Do nst use this form for proposali to drill or to deepen or plug
Use “AP

CATION FOR PERMIT—" for sof}{profiohli. b aathitiics

nt reservolr.

4. IF IXDIAM, ALLOTTES OK TRIBS NAX3E

i B
oIL GAS
WILL WXLL OTHER

T. UXTY AGRXXMENT NAMME

1. XAME OF OPARATOR

Flying J, Inc.

8. FAxd OR LEAAR XAME

Ute Tribal

3, ADORNAN OF OFSRLTOR

P.0. Box 175 North Salt Lake, Utah 84054

9. WELL XO.

2-3472

3. LoCATION OF WELL (Raeport locstion élearly aod In accordance with any State requirements.®
in u;? apace 17 below.)
t urizce

10, FIZLD AXD POOL, OK WILDCAT

11, a3C, %, 3, X, OR BLK, AXD
SCRYARY OR A2RA

T. IN R, 2W Sec. 34

NOTICE NP IXTEXTIION T0:

TERXT WATEIR SXUT-OFY PULL OR ALTER CASING

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE

SHOOT OX ACIDIZE ARANDON®

REPAIR WELL CUHANGE PLANS (Other)

WATER SHUT-OFF
FRACTURE TREATMENT

SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING

T4. AP)1 NUMBER - 15, PLXYATIONS (SBow whether Dr, XT, GX, #is.) 13, COONTY OR Piriax| 18, 3TATS
43-013-31167 Duchesne Utah
. 16 Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data

SUBSAQUANT RIPORT OF:

REPAIRING WELL
ALTERING CaABING

ABANUON WK ENT®

Change of Operator X

(Other) i

(Nots: Report results of multiple completion os Well
(‘nmpletion nr Recompletion Report and Log turm.)

propased work., If well is directionmally drilled, give subsurface
nant to this work.) *

1989.

March 15,

s,

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CUMPLETED UPHRATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent detaily, and give pertinent dates. Including estimated date of itarting any
ions and messured and true vertical depths for all markers snd zones perti-

The above well was taken over by Flying J, Inc. from GW Petroleum, effective

14, 1 haredy oo that m;?wuu is true and correct
ucm*jz)up NLhA_L

(This space for Federtl or State office use)

e _Technical Assistant parm_October 25, 1989

e —r———— e ————————— T ———————e———

DATR

APPROVED BY :
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANT:

*See |nstructions an Reverse Side




DIVISION OF 0OlL, GAS, AND MINING

. Form OGC-1b
- QSTATE OF UTAH
DEPARTWCENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

N UT N TRIPLICATE®
her instructions on
o reverse side)

S. LEASK DESIONATION \NXD 3ERI4L MO.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

lug back.to a_different reservolr.
ch'?rop'ogut.) ' LT

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen—or P
Use “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—'" (o

8. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTES OR TRISE NAME

otL uAs

WELL WEILL OTHIR

T. UNIT AGREEMENT NaMa

2, NAME OF OPIRATOR

GW Petroleum Inc.

8. raru os

See Attached

L2ASE NAME

3. ADDREZS OF OFPSXATOR [

1111 Bagby, Suite 1700 Houston, Texas 77002 -

9. WEBLL NO.

x See Attached

4. LOCJTION OF WELL (Repart location clearly and In accordance with any State requxrimentn.'

See also space 17 delow.)
At surface

See Attached

10. PIBLD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

11, amc,, T, X, M., ORL ILX, AND
SURYRY OR AkB4

14, PERMIT XO,

15. mxvarions (Show whether ofF, xT, g8, wto.)

18. sTiTE

I R

Uintah

18. Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature

NOTICE OF INTINTION TO:

-

TEST WATEIR SEUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE
SHOOT OR ACIGIZE ABANDON®
REPAIR WELL CUHANGE PLANS

{Other)

of Notice, Repont, or Other Data

SUBSIQUENT REBPORT OF:

WATER SHUT-OFP REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTZRING CASING

SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING ABANUDONMENT®

(other) _Change of Overator

{NoTE: Report results of multiple complecion on Weli
(ompletion or Recompietion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROVASKED OR CUMILETED OPERATIONS (Cleurly state nll pertinent detalls, and give pertinent dates, ineluding estimuted date of starting any

proposed wark. If well is directionally drilled.
nent w this work.) *

¥ive subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depchs foc all markers and zones perti-

Effective April 1, 1989, Flying J Corporation took over operation of the wells

listed on the following attachment.

MICROFILM
A FILE

;t;,/‘

18. I hereby cert that the foregoing s true and correct

SIGNED lbé*&&// At s TrrLe _Engineering Aide pate _ 10/27/89
{This space for Federal or State office use)
APPTAVED BY TITLE DATE

CUliwiaa. '3 OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side



.

- .""J ‘ //— i
P | | 4

WELL NAME API NUMBER LOCATION WELL NAME API NUMBER LOCATION
N UTE TRIBAL #2 4301330020 00650 1S5 IW 8 KW CARRELL #1 4301330158 02307 25 3W 27 — F€C
™~ GOSE GOVT #1 4304720171 00695 65 21E 19 VD, R. LONG 2-19A1E 4304731470 09505 1S 1E 19 ~#XC
~~GOST GOVT 2-18 4304720062 00697 6S 21E 18 "\ OBERHANSLY 2-3121 4301330970 09725 1IN 1w 31 ~F¢L
K. SHISLER #1 . 4301330041 00700 1S IW 9 .0 MOON 2-2671 4304731480 10135 1IN IW 26 -t
“NUTE TRIBAL 2-358 4301330106 00705 IN 2W 35 "™ PAPADOPULOS 2-34A1E 4304730683 10610 15 1E 34 ~F4E&
NE. YUMP §1 4301330167 00710 1N 1W 31 :JESSEN 2-14A4 4301331160 10611 1S 4w 14 72€€
“\YTE TRIBAL 1-268 430133?}1}65_)%;715 IN 2W 26 S UTE TRIBAL #2-3422 4301331167 10668 1IN 2W 34
“FARNSWORTH #1 4301376¥89 00730 15 4w 18— F e S BASTIAN #3-8A1 4301331181 10758 15 10 8 —FCC
““SHINER #1-14A4 4301330258 00735 15 4W 14— [<2 ™ LILA D. #2-25A1 4304731797 10790 1S 1 25 ~FLC
NBASTIAN 1-2A1 4304731373 00736 1S IN 2= frl
™ CARSON 2-36A1 4304731407 00737 1S 1W 36

NGV, MILES #1 4301330275 00740 1S 4W 20 — [¢¢

“NA. RUST #2 4301330290 00745 15 4W 22 = FeL L, . ~

REARY 1-X17A3 4301330326 00750 1S 3W 17 i€ > ns decuman fofio 7@«»—»« Flyng 3

UTE TRIBAL 1-32Z1 4301330324 00755 1IN IW 32 o M eAe~7<
NGOVT 4-14 4304730155 00760 65 20E 14
“SADIE BLANK 1-33Z1 4301330355 00765 1IN IN 33 — {22
“+UTE TRIBAL 1-34B 4301310494 00775 1IN 2W 34
“UTE TRIBAL 1-16 4304730231 00780 1S 1E 16
™ PAPADOPULOS 1-34A1E 4304730241 00785 1S 1E 34—[(¢
“\C. J. HACKFORD 1-23 4304730279 00790 1S 1E 23 .- f£¢C

NUTE TRIBAL 1-35A1E 4304730286 00795 1S 1E 35
~ 7 (sts)
UTE TRIBAL 1-IMAILE 4304730421 00800 1S 1E 27

“\DAVIS 1-33 4304730384 00805 15 1E 33— Fel
UTE TRIBAL 1-22ALE 4304730429 00810 1S 1E 22
“\LARSEN 1-25A1 4304730552 00815 1S 1W 25 — e
. DRY GULCH 1-36A1 4304730569 00820 15 1W 36~f¢L
“\NELSON 1-31ALE 4304730671 00830 15 1E 31—F2
“UTE TRIBAL 1-32A1E 4304730676 00835 1S 1E 32
“NROSEMARY LLOYD 1-24A1E 4304730707 00840 1S 1E 24 -FeL
S H. D. LANDY 1-30AIE 4304730790 00845 1S 1E 30 =%
“\UTE TRIBAL 1-15ALE 4304730820 00859 1S 1E 15
“N.WALKER 1-14A1E 430473083¢ o%’é‘éz 15 1€ 14~ -
“\\UTE TRIBAL 1-17AIE 4304730829 00860 1S 1E 17
“\UTE TRIBAL 1-25A1E 4304730830 00865 1S 1E 25
~ FAUSETT 1-26A1E 4304730821 00870 15 1E 26—:<L ,
““HOUSTON 1-3471 4301330566 00885 1IN 1W 34-§¢¢ )
E. FISHER #2-26A4 4301331119 00890 1S 4W 26 ~F2¢
“\UTE TRIBAL 1-29A1E 4304730937 00895 1S 1E 29
™~ BOLTON 2-29A1E 4304731112 00300 15 1E 29-F¢¢
. N WISSE 1-2811 _ 4301330609 00905 1N IW 28--C
“\POWELL 1-2181 4301330621 00910 25 1w 21 —F¢
“\.UTE TRIBAL 2-22A1E 4304731265 00915 1S 1E 22 —pet
N L. BOLTON 1-12Al 4304731295 00320 1S IW 12 22
““H. MARTIN 1-2171 4301330707 00925 1IN IW 21 ~F&L
"\ FONLES 1-26A1 - 4304731296 00930 1S 1W 26 . F2t
N LAWSON 1-21A1 4301330738 00935 1S IW 21 —f€(
“vR. HOUSTON 1-22721 4301330884 00936 1IN 1W 22 ~ F&C
“\BIRCHELL 1-27A1 4301330758 00940 1S 1W 27 ~ F&
¢ WESLEY BASTIAN FEE #1 4301310496 00942 1S IW 8 — F(2
\KNIGHT #1 4301330184 01090 25 3W 28 -2
\HYRIN RANCH #1 4301330176 01091 2S 3W 20 ~f28
\LDUSTIN #1 4301330122 01092 25 3W 22— F&¢
“HANSEN #1 4301330161 01093 25 3W 23 ~KL

\PRESCOTT 1-35Z1 4304731173 01425 1IN IW 35;,“"



Form OGCC-1be SUBMIT IN TR!PIQTI‘ }4

STATE OF UTAH (Other Instructions on re-
verve side) 5. LEASE DESIONATION AND BBNIAL NO.

OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION 14-20-H62-1704

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS . Ir INDILR. ALLOTIAR O TRiny MANE

{Do pot use this form for ;ro sale to drill or to deepen or pl\upblcw a) different reservolr. Ute TY"i be
s.) .

Use “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—!' xoxngg P o
i H ~ ) 7. UNIT AGREEMANT NAMB
on. [1%) h A
wBLL wBLL OTHER 7 i
. ¥am» or oraaatoR : ) N é"j 8. FARN OR LBYSE NAMD
Flying J. INc = JAN 121990 & Ute
3. ADDREAS OF OPBRATOR $. WBLL No.
VS A
PO Drawer 130, Ballard Utah 84066 L Uil OF 2-34-7-2
4. wulou OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance wlth%ddy._lmﬁrg’qqi}&bgqﬁ.' 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
also space 17 delow.) TR
. At surtace Bluebell/Wasatch
\ 11, 8nC,, 7., &, M., OR DLE, AND

SURYBY OR ARBA

Sec. 34 TIN, R2Y

13. COUNTY OR PARINK| 18, STATH

1223' FSL, 1957' FWL, SE S

34, PRRMIT NO. 15. BLEVATIONS (Show whether D7, RT, 0%, #ts.)
43-013-31167 5921' Ung. GL Duchesne Utah
16. Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: BUBEBQUBNT RBPORT OF:

TEST WATER SNUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER BSHUT-OFPF - RETAIRING WBLL
PRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT - ALTERING CABING
SHOOT OR ACIDISE ABANDON® SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT®
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other) - {
(Other) , e ROt icrion, Heort and Log form.) -

. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMI'LETED OPERATIONS (Clenrly state all pertinent detalis, and give pertinent dates, fncluding estimated date of starting an
17.» roposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and mcu\fred E:d true vertical depths for all markers and sones pertl-

:.Mbthh work.) ¢

12-22-89 Acidize existing Wasatch perfs 14121' to 15027' 80' 240 perfs with
8000 gal 15% HCL containing 5 gal corrosion inhibitor pr. 1000 gal
15% HCL. 3 gal non emulsifier pr. 1000 gal 15% HCL 10 1bs. Iron
control pr. 1000 gal 15% HCL and 10 gal scale inhibitor pr. 1000 gal
15% HCL. Divert with 480 1.1 sg 7/8" RCN Ball sealers & 2000 1bs.
rock salt w/50 1bs gel. pr. 1000 gal brine water. Pump as follows:
Five 38 bbl. stages acid with 1 ball sealer every 16.7 gals., four
-12 bbls. stages gelled brine water and rock salt displace acid to
Btm perf with 290 bbls KCL water.

Max PSI 8050 avg PSI 7000 PSI minimum 500 PSI ava. Injection rate
10 BPM I1.S.I.P. 2120 5 min O WWell on vacuum. .

A-TAS >

18. T hereby cer jhat tby foregoing is true and correct i J
SIGNED _M%Mmmn District Supervisqs  wicrosmmx 1/#/90

(This space for Federal or State office use) - FILE
DATE

APPROVED BY TITLE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side



m OGCC-1 be
STATE OF UTAH

OlL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

S - 7

{

BUBMIT IN TRH’LXCAI l-'

{Other Instructions on re-
verve slde)

. LEABE DERIONATION AND BERIAL RO,

. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTED OR TRINE NAMK

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

sals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservolr.

{Do not use this form for

ro
Use “AP LrgATXON FOR PERMIT—"" for sueh.propossis}ro
e et VA RN A i
i K 7. UNIT AGRECMEXT NAMS
oIL LYy} z
WELL WELL OTHER £
$. XAMD OF OPEXATOR i 8. YaARM OR LB4SE XAXS
. 225 apg 06
Flying J Inc et Al d
$. ApDR3as OF OrsXATOR 9. wWBLL NO.
- DIGN OF
PO Drawer 130 Roosevelt, Utah 84066  Yiriwi»iv: .
$§. LOCATION OF WELL (Beport location clearly and in mccordance with/any State requirements.® 10. PIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
See also space 17 below.)
At surface
11. s=C,, 7., R, M., OX BLK. AND
SURYRY OR ARNJ
14. PERMIT XO. 15, BLIVATIONS {Bhow whether DI, RT, OR, sto.) 12, COUXTY OR PARIZH] 13, S8TATE
1s. Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Repont, or Other Data

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO:
TEET WATER BEUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CABING

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE

BHOOT OR ACIDILIE ABANDON®

BUBSEQUENZ REPORT OF:

WATER BHUT-OFF
TRACTURE TREATMENT

BHOUTING OR ACIDIZING

REFAIRING WELL
ALTERING CaBING

ABANDONMENT®

REPAIR WEKLL
(Other) Flare Gas

CHANGE FLANB

{Other) t
(NoTx : Report results of multiple compietion on Well
Campletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

enrly state all pertinent detalls, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting an

17. DESCXRIBE PROPOSED OR CUMI'LETED OPERATIONS (C) )
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give su

nent to this work.) *

beurface Jocations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and xones pertl.

In reference to the two telephone conversations between Jim Hooks of Flyina J Inc.” Ron Firth
of the Division of 0il, Gas & Minina, and Ed Forsman of the Bureau of Land Management on
July 27, 1990, concerning the explosion and subsequent -closure of the Gary Refinina Inc. Gas

Plant located in Cederview.

Notification is submitted of our intent to flare gas on the wells

listed below from the evening of July 21, 1990, (the time of the explosion) to when Gary

Refining Inc. is back in operation.

Possibly as late as Auaust 31, 1990°

Bpproximately 39%

of the cas production on the wells listed well be used as Tease fuel.

WELL NAHC RéMBE COURTY  AFIT § ¥ELL KAHE SECTION TOWNI 4™ RAKSE APT 4
£ - 15 1% . B 013~ H 34 15 {E ¢ 04
7 i5 14 ] g } s o . - -,
9 ¢ 4 x o £l in tH 5 01
29 18 it b G4 it 26 1% i L 04
iz 15 14 Y {4 POy 7 o u % r
o . o ‘o o ! £ £5 % i ik
& iz 1w U 04 TERY 15 2g i y ne
1 T g i ! v . L U/
: e i5 L uoom UTE | 15 18 1€
2 L¥ v UTE | 75 (5 e E g
ISTGK 34 i# 1% i G UTE 1§ 35 14 1§ H
F HOUSTOH 1-221¢ ¥ 1% 1¥ i {1 UTE 7 37 1z 15 .
. oy rAiT - ‘e ~ . . - L4 g £ U
Rb LANDY 1-30A1E 30 is iE ] i UIE 2 14 0N o .
H I o : . = Ll iR P4 ] I
LILA 25 15 1H b {4
18. 1 bereby e;tu/ythnt vezofn}“ﬁ'tkﬁe nd correct
Bmmm/ //M//, ! o mirie Field Superintendent pats _8/2/90
(This space for Federal or State office use) L TR TR e .
APPROVED BY THE STATE
APPROVED BY TITLE OF-UTAL-DIVISIGN OF

CONKDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

L, GAS, AND MINING
(&4

-

TR,

*See Instructions on Reve



Form g

DEPARTMENT

STAZEaOF UTAH

TURAL RESQURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

8. Leasa Uesignaton ana Senai Numoer

/4-2D - H62 -170F

7. Ingian Allottee or Trbse Nama

B SUNDRY.NOTI_CES AND'REPORTS ON'VWELLS

8. Unit or Communttization Agresment

Flying J Oil & Gas Inc.

i1, Type of Weid o stAr A 9 e 9. Weil Name ana Numzger
Qit Ga ther (speci U
& % O & O (specity huv | 1/92 Ute 2-3472
2. Name of Qperatos - 10. AP! Wall Numoper

L. 43-013-31167__ . _ .

=
P

I Addressof Operator -~ - - o T prone N T1. Freid and Poot, or Wildeat
P.0. Box 540180 North Salt Lake, UT 84054- 0180 [?801)298 7733 Bluebell

§. Location of Weil
Sootage 1223" FSL, 1957' FWL County :  Duchesne
QQ.See. T..R. M. SE SW Sec. 34, TlN; R2W State T UTAH

 CHECKAPPROPRIALE BOXES TO.INDICATENAIURE OE NOLICE. REDORT . OROIHER DALA.

NOTICE OF INTENT
{Submit in Duplicate)

SUBSEZQUENT REPORT
{Submit Original Form Oniy)

g: Abandonment E] New Construciion D Abandonment * G New Construction
[ Casing Repair (J Pull or Alter Casing (] Casing Repair (J Pull or Alter Casing
d Change of Plans (] Recompletion (] Changeof Plans a Shoot or Acidize
O Conversion to Injection (] Shaotar Acidize {Q Conversian to Injection O Ventor Flare

g Fracture Treat (J Ventor Flara O Fracture Treat E] Water Shut-Off
O Muitipie Completion (Q Water Shut-QOft (0 Cther

@ Ogner Clean up pit & install tank

Date of Wark Compietion

Appraximate Date Work Will Start

Report rasults of Muitipie Compolatons and Recompietions (o different resarvoirs
on WELL COCMPLETION QR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form.

* Must be acsompanied by a cament ven'ﬁcan’on report,

m

13. DESCRIBE PROPOSED CR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details. and give pertinent dates. 1t weil is duecucnaity drilled. give subsurfaca
locations and measured and true vertical depths for ail markers and zonas pertinent to Mis work.)

Flying J requests approval to close the existing emergency pit at the referenced
location and install an above ground tank for containment of fluids. The tank will
receive produced fluids only in emergency situation involving upsets at the well's
production facilities and fluids in the tank will be removed & properly disposed in
a timely manner. The existing pit will be cleaned up by treating and separating as
much fluid as possible through the production facility and by using newly developed
bioremediation composting techniques on any remaining hydrocarbons.

14. | hereqy certfly

WQ xst%
_Jobo R, Baza

{State Usa Oniy)
4&%«:&, Grﬁ)ﬁ?, e DoSu.
(3/90)

See Instructions on Reversa Side

Name & Signature

Tile R, Petroleum EpgineePa® 11/16/92




. Form 3160-3 UNl% STATES

. a8 ‘5 FORM APPROVED
(June 1990} DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ¢ Ll vt
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT!"" - L j; S Lease Designanos and Serml No.
L 1= L -
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON! Elpl;s:fﬂﬂg GAS & ev@gtéz'gég —if lodian. Alouss or Tribe Nome
1% 1l poipay [¥1111
Do not use this form for proposails to drill or to deepen or reeqir } b0 different-reservoir:--
Use “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposals
7. If Unxt or CA, Agreemeont Designaaoa
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE =
T Type of Well K/A
_B% OW o 1. Well Nama ead Mo.
7. Name of Operasor —347—
Samson Resources Company 9. APt Well No.
3. Address and Telephooe No. -
Two West Second Street, Tulsa, OK 74103 (918) 583-1791 10. Field and Pool. or Exploraory Area
. Locanos of Well (Fooage, Sec.. 1., K., M., or Survey Descripaom) Bluebell (Wasatch)
, t1. County or Purish, Stse
1223' PSL and 1957' FWL of Section 34-1N-2W Duchesne, Utah
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION - TYPE OF ACTION
@ Notce of Intest : D Absadosment D Change of Plaas
O Casing Repaic [ weter soor
D Final Abandoamest Notice D Alsering Casing . . Coaversion 1 Injection
K] omer Change of Operator (] Dispose Waser
(New: Report resuis of suisipit compictca s Well
Compittson o1 Recompienen Repon and Log ferm.)

13. Mwaww(wyummmmmmmmmmamnywmuﬂhwm
mmmumm“mmummummnumr

Samson Resources Company will assume operations of this well from Flying J 011 and Gas Inc.,
effective July 1, 1994.

Please be advised that Samson Resources Company, effective July 1, 1994, will be responsible
under the terms and conditions of the lease for the operations conducted upon the leased lands.
Bond coverage will be provided by Bond No. 305100844034BGA.

T I 1o A
[N R TR S A
- _J -2 Mg]i’ A

e A
Signod : e __District Engineer Dase (—2/-9¢
(This space for or State office was) L N

e e -
Approved by [s] HOWARD R ¢} EAVINGER 1™ " — Dase AUG 2 9 1994 :

of approval, if any:

e Scction 1001, makes & 8 crime for &y persos knowingly e2d willfully 10 make % sy deparsmen or ageacy of the United Stacs any false. fictitions of freudulent smasemencs
otwmnb-ymvi‘-'nw&ﬁu. .
'Sulmtmctlonoqknmmswo

7




e s AR

DIVISION OF () GAS AND MINING

. Loase Designation and Seriai Number )

14-20-H62~1704

7. Indian Aliottes or Tribe Name

Ute
Do - Unit or Communitization AQreement
w N/A
1. Type of Well 9. Well Name and Number

Well O

Gas

Gae D Other (specity}

Ute 2-34Z2

:2. Name of Operator

Samson Resourc

es Company

10. APt Well Number

43-013-31167

3. Address of Operator

Two West Second St., Tulsa, OK 74103-3103

4. Telephone Number
(918) 583-1791

11. Field and Pool, or Witdcat -

Bluebell (Wasatch)

5. Location of Weli

Footage

1223' FSL and 1957' FWL
SE/4 SW/4 Section 3

County : Duchesne

(Submitin Duplicate)

(] Abandonment [J New Construction
{J Casing Repair ] Pull or Alter Casing
(J Change of Plans (] Recompletion

(J Conversion to Injection (J Shoot or Acidize
(] Fracture Treat (J Ventor Flare

(] Muttipie Completion [J water Shut-Ott
Other _Change of Operator

(o o [

imate Date Work Will Start _ july 1, 1994

Abandonment *
Casing Repair
Change of Plans

Convarsion to lnjection

Fracture Treat
Other

{0 New Construction
(] Pull or Alter Casing
[J Shoot or Acidize
(] VentorFlare

(J Water Shut-Oft

Date of Work Completion

Report results of Muitiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs
on WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form.

¢ Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

13. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and

locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

give pertinent dates. if well is directionaily drilied, give subsurtace

Samson Resources Company will assume operations of this well from Flying J 0il and Gas Inc.,

effective July 1

> 1994,

14, | hargby certify that the locegoing is true and correct

Ne gnature g,\ )ﬂ .

27

-1

THe District Engineer Date ¢-2/~94

‘Rate Use Only) 7

\"4

See Instructions on Raeverse Side



Form 3160-5 UNIQ) STATES il J j

(June 19901 DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR i/ ;

i
H
:

FORM APPROVED
Budget Durems No. 1004-0135
U Experes Masrch 31, 99)

'L /i14-20-062-1704

T 6. If Indsan. Allomes or Tribe Name

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON v
Do not use this form for proposais to drilt or to deepen or reentry.
Use “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposais

' Ute
7. If Uait or CA. Agreemems Desigasnon

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE

1. Type of Well N/A
3den Dgfén [ oxter ‘ S. Wel Nams and No.

2. Name of Operaior Ote 2-34Z-2

Flying J. 01l and Gas Inc. 9. APt Well No.
3. Address and Telephone No. (801) 298-/733 43-013-31167

P. 0. Box 540180, North Salt Lake, Utah 84054-0180 10. Field and Foal. or Explonmey Arm
4. Locauon of Weil (Fooage, Sec.. T.. R.. M., of Survey Descriptom) Bluebell (Wasatch)

11. County oc Parish, Stass

1223' FSL and 1957' FWL of Section 34-1R-2W

Duchesne, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION . TYPE OF ACTION
@ Notxe of Intemt . D Absndoament D Change of Plans
D Subsequent Report D Plugging Back D Nos-Rowtine Fracwring
Casing Repeir D Waer Shet-Off
DﬁnlAbamNm DMC&N DCmnhm
&) oter __Change of Operator [ Dispose Water
(Noar: Repon resuis of muhiple compintse es Well
Compieuon of Recompiones Repon aad Log farm )

13. Descnbe Wacmmw(cwymwmm.mmmam. Mmmmdmuywmﬂnﬂiwm
mmmmmwmmmfwmmummmmmr

Flying J 0il and Gas Inc. will transfer operations of this well to Samson Resources Company,
effective July 1, 1994.

Please be advised that Samson Resources Company, effective July 1, 1994, will be responsible
under the terms and conditions of the lease for the operations conducted upon the leased
lands. Bond coverage will be provided by Bond KNo. 305100844034BGA.

Jik 3 s
’ LR SR S PINSI RS
14, | hereby fy that the foregowng is true and cofrect '
Signed M’\M/w NQ.\ Tide \/Fr-p ﬁf&s 0/;&1 v b=2Y Y
for Federal or Stas office use) I A 1994
wis! HOWARD B, CLEAVINGER I Tie KRN S pae _AUG 2 9

Coaditions of spproval, if aoy:

Tite uu.s.C.Seco'cnNDI.MBilu’imforuymwdmbmummawdmumdMMN&m“mm
awanmvﬁhwm ’

— e esevana:
——
—

*See Instruction on Reverse Side



Formg* ~ STAT UTAH N .
N DEPARTMENT OF RAL RESOURCEESE‘ ! 6. Lease Designation and Senal NUumber
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 14-20-H62~1704
: 7. indian Aliottes or Tribe Name
~ SUNDRY.NOTICES AND.REPORTS ON'WELLS Ute
Do. or | sals 0 ow wells, deepan ex 8. Unit or Communitization Agreement

4 this form for proposals to drllf new mnc. doopc(t_o’xjgd

N/A

Gas
Well

C] ("_‘] Other (specify)

9. Well Name and Number
Ute 2-34Z2

2. Name of Operator
Flying J 01l and Gas Inc.

10, APU Well Number
43-013-31167

3. Address of Operator
P, 0. Box 540180, North Salt Lake, Utah

11. Field and Pool, or Wildcat -
Bluebell (Wasatch)

4, Telophone Number
(801) 298-7733

5. Location of Wek

Footage : 1223' FSL and 1957' FWL

QQ, Sec,. T.A. M. : SE/4 SW/4 Section 34~IN-2W

County : Duchesne
. UTAH

imate Date Work Will Start  Jy1y 1, 1994

12,0
(J Abandonment (J New Construction (J Abandonment * (0 New Construction
(Q Casing Repair [J Pull or Alter Casing [J Casing Repair [ Pull or Alter Casing
[J Change of Plans O .Recompleuon [J Change of Plans (] Shoot or Acidize
(] Conversion to Injection (J Shoot or Acidize (J Coaversion to Injection (J VentorFlare
(] Fracture Treat (Q Ventor Flare (Q Fracture Treat [ Water Shut-Oft
(O Muttipie Completion [J Water Shut-Oft [J Other
(B Other change of Operator
Date of Work Completion

Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different ressrvoirs
on WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

13. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state

all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. if well [g directionaily drilled, give subsurtace

locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Flying J 0il and Gas Inc. will transfer operations of this well to Samson Resources Comp:%ny,

effective July 1, 1994,

!

4. | hargby certify

Qnature

that foregoing is true and correct

Ne
g{o U

s8 Only) (/ »

2/90)

()\\rf Or@_g O’mﬂm é -29-9Y Date

See Instructions on Reverse Side



( FLYING J OIL & GAS INC.

333 WEST CENTER STREET - P.O.BOX 540180  NORTH SALT LAKE, UTAH 84054-0180
PHONE (801) 298-7733 * FAX (801) 298-9394

AN 2919 f

i Y
June 28, 1994 | GIV_OF OIL, GAS & Wikika |

ALL INTEREST OWNERS

RE: Ute Tribal 2-3472 Well
Township ! North, Range 2 West, USM 47 017-5 /e /
Section 34: All
Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Effective July 1, 1994, Flying J Oil & Gas Inc. will resign as Operator of the above
captioned oil and gas well. The Successor Operator will be Samson Resources Company,
as listed below:

Mr. David Hoffman

Samson Resources Company
Two West Second Street
Tulsa, Oklahoma 74103
Telephone 918 583-1791

Should you have any questions, contact Mr. David Hoffman or the undersigned.

Sincerely,

FLYING J OIL & GAS INC.

é’ﬁ% w&&?é%{///
ralie Timothy ;
Lease Records Administrator

/ct



N

Division of 0il, Gas and Mining

Routj_M

OPERATOR CHANGE HORKSHEET P
1-LRG /-PL A
Attach all documentation received by the division regarding this change. 2-LWP 8-SJ /
Initial each listed item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable. 3-DYFS9-FILE
4-VLC A,
XXX Change of Operator (well sold) O Designation of Agent 5s-RIF
0 Designation of Operator O Operator Name Change Only 6- LWP 1/
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed (EFFECTIVE DATE: _ /~1-94 )
TO (new operator) SAMSON RESOURCES COMPANY FROM (former operator) FLYING J INC
(address) TWO WEST SECOND STREET (address) PO BOX 540180
TOLSA, OK 74103 N SALT LAKE CITY, UT 84504
DAVID HOFFMAN CORALIE TIMOTHY
phone ( 918) 583-1791 phone (801 )298-7733
account no. _N 8020 account no. _N1195

Hell(s) (attach additional page if needed):

Name:UTE TRIBAL 2—3422/GRWS API .43_013"'31167 Entity:10668 SeciTwa_Rng_z_w_ LeaSE Type: INDIAN

- Name: APT:_ . Entity: __Sec___Twp__ Rng__ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec_ _Twp___Rng___ Lease Type:
Name : API: Entity: Sec__ Twp__ _Rng___ Lease Type:
Name : API: Entity: Sec__ _Twp__ _Rng___ Lease Type:
Name: APT: Entity: Sec__ _Twp___Rng___ Lease Type:
Name : APY: Entity: Sec__ Twp__ _Rng___ lLease Type:

OPERATOR CHANGE DOCUMENTATION

S

Py

R~
5,1

ek 6.
. Well File labels have been updated for each well listed above. 9—5_75/

Ny

x>

S

i.

(Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or other legal documentatjon has been received from former
operator (Attach to this form). /gy (-27-94) (fec'd 7599

. (Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or other ] ] do<;>mentation has been received from pew operator

(Attach to this form). (jy 26-%) ( foctid 789

The Department of Commerce has been contacted if the new operator above is not currently
operating any wells in Utah. TIs company registered with the state? (yes/no) If
yes, show company file number: .

. (For Indian and Federal Hells ONLY) The BLM has been contacted regarding this change

(attach Telephone Documentation Form to this report). Make note of BLM status in
comments section of this form. Management rveview of Federal and Indian well operator
changes should take place prior to completion of steps 5 through 9 below.

. Changes have been eptered in the 0il and Gas Information System (Wang/IBM) for each well

listed above. /%./.5Y,
Cardex file has been updated for each well listed above. 7-4-5¢

Changes have been included on the monthly "Operator, Address, and Account Changes" memo
for distribution to State Lands and the Tax Commission. [?,4,,?5/7

. A folder has been set up for the Operator Change file, and a copy of this page has been

placed there for reference during routing and processing of the original documents.

- OVER -

) ‘

l



OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (CONTINUED) Initial each item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable.

ENTITY REVIEH

V4

J26 1. (Rule R615-8-7) Entity assignments have been reviewed for all wells listed above. HWere
entity changes made? (yes/Mc (If entity assignments were changed, attach copies of
Form 6, Entity Action Form).

J%é 2. State Lands and the Tax Commission have been notified through normal procedures of
entity changes. ’

BOND VERIFICATION (Fee wells only)
N/ ). (Rule R615-3-1) The new operator of any fee lease well listed above has furnished a

oo proper bond.

2. A copy of this form has been placed in the new and former operators' bond files.

3. The former operator has requested a release of liability from their bond (yes/no) _ .
Today's date ' 19 . If yes, division response was made by letter

dated _ 19 .

LEASE INTEREST OHNER NOTIFICATION RESPONSIBILITY

kﬁé& 1. (Rule R615-2-10) The former operator/lessee of any fee lease well listed above has been
notified by letter dated 19 , of their responsibility to notify any

v/ﬁ / person with an interest in such Tease of the change of operator. Documentation of such

notification has been requested.

;70
N/ 2. Copies of documents have been sent to State Lands for changes involving State leases.

FILMING ‘
i/ 1. A1l attachments to this form have been microfilmed. Date: 5514%29 Z%Q% éi;& 19 f%?‘

FILING

1. Copies of all attachments to this form have been filed in each well file.

2. The original of this form and the original attachments have been filed in the Operator
Change file.

COMMENTS

rﬁ/ﬂ%’é g/él//x@/'ﬁa/ /Z/rt/. §-29-9¢ A /"iﬂl/

WE71/34-35



" Form 3160-5 ' UNITEL »TATES
(June 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposals

FORM APPROVED
Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
Expires: March 31, 1993
5. Lease Designation and Serial No.
1420H621704
6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

UTE

7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE
1. Type of Well
Oil Gas 8. Well Name and No.
[(X]wen [Jwetl [_Jother
2. Name of Operator Ute 23472
Samson Resources Company 9. APl Well No.
43-013-31167

3. Address and Telephone No.
2 West 2nd Street, Tulsa, OK 74103 (918) 683-1791

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)
SE/4 SW/4 SEC 34-1N-2W

Altamont-Wasatch
11. County or Parish, State

Duchesne, UT
12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[X]Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans
Recompletion New Construction
[Jsubsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing
Casing Repair Water Shut-Off
[CJFinal Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection
Other  Change of Operator Dispose Water
Effectivedanuary 18, 1396 _ tNote: Reportresutts of muttiple compietion on Well
Completion or Recomptetion Report and Log form.)

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. if well is
directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent fo this work.)*

this lease to Coastal 0il & Gas Corp.

Effective _January 18, 199€amson Resources Company is turing over operations of

14. | hereby certify that or

is correct
A~ Title

Signed Production Analyst Date 1/17/96
(This spaceéaf Federal or State office use)
Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements

of representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction,

*See Instruction on Reverse Side



»
Form 3160-5 U'! 'IED STATES FORM APPROVED

- une 1990) 'DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR  Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31,1993
fff s " C '() Lease Designation and Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS T 2 a0-H62-1704
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. IfIndian, Alottee or Tribe Name
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" — for such proposals '
Ute
7. ItUnitor CA, Agreement Designation
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE
1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.
Oil Well D Gas Well D Other Ute #2—-3472
2. Name of Operator 9. APl Well No.
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-013-31167
3. Address and Telephone No. 10. Field andPool, Or Exploratory Area
P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201 —0749 (303) 573—4455 | Altamont
4. Locatlon of Well (Footage, Sac.. T.. R.. M., Or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, State

SE/SW Section 34 I'IN~R2W

Duchesne County, UT

12, CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

D Notice of Intent D Abandonment D Change of Plans
l:] Recompletion D New Construction
Subsequent Report D Plugging Back D Non--Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair D Water Shut—Off
D Final Abandonment Notice D Altering Casing ,:I Conversion to injection
oter Change of Operator DDispoée Water
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well
Cony. or R D Repot and Log form)

13.  Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent detalls, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any pi'opo‘se’d"work. It well is directionalty
drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and tru vertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent to this work.)* . .

Please be advised that effective January 18, 1996, Samson Resources Company turned over operatorship of the subject well to
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation. All operations will be covered by the following nationwide bonds:

State of Utah: #102103
BLM: #U605382-9
BIA: #114066—A

14. | hereby certity tha foregoing is true and correct .
Signf\_%&&v“/w Tite Environmental & Safety Analyst pate 02/16/96

[/ .
Sheila Bremer
(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C, Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, ficticlous or fraudulent statements or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse Side
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UNITED STATES GOVERNMENT

memorandum

DATE: March 26, 1996
REPLY TO
ATTNOF: Superintendent, Uintah and Ouray Agency
SUBJECT: Change of Operator

Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office
To: Attention: Sally Gardiner, Division of Minerals and Mining

We have received copies of Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells (Form 3160-5),
requiring BIA Action, informing this office of a change of operator for the
following wells:

OPERATOR - FROM: Samson Resources Company
TO: Coastal 0il & Gas Corporation

TOWNSHIP 1 NORTH, RANGE 2 WEST, USB&M
Sec | Well Name/No. Lease No.
34 Ute No. 2-347Z2 14-20-H62-1704

This office recommends a approval for the Changes of Operator for the wells
listed above.

All operations will be covered under a $150,000 Nationwide Bond filed with
this office for Coastal.

If you have any questions, please contact this office at (801) 722-2406, Ext.

51/52/54.

cc: Jerry Kenczka, BLM/Vernal
Energy & Minerals, Ute Tribe
Ute Distribution Corporation, Roosevelt, UT
Lisha Cordova, State of Utah
Theresa Thompson, BLM/State Office

OPTIONAL. FORM NO. 10
(REV. 1-80)

GSA FPMR (41 CFR) 101-11.6
5010-114

*U.5.GPO:1990-0-262-081/20165



Attach all documentation received by the division regarding this change.
Initial each listed item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable.

) ®
pividion of 0il, Gas and Mining
OPERATOR CHANGE HORKSHEET

XXX Change of Operator (well sold) 0O Designation of Agent
3 Designation of Operator O Operator Name Change Only
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed (EFFECTIVE DATE: 1-18-96 )
TO (new operator) COASTAL OIL & GAS CORP FROM (former operator) SAMSON RESOURCES COMPANY
(address) PO BOX 749 (address) TWO W 2ND ST
DENVER CO 80201-0749 TULSA OK 74103

phone ( 303) 572-1121 phone (918 )583-1791
account no. _N0230 account no. _N8020

Hell(s) (attach additional page if needed):

Name :UTE TRIBAL 2—3422/GRWS API43—013—31167 Entity 10668 Sec34 TwpliRng_ZE Lease Type: INDIAN

Name :
Name :
Name :
Name:
Name ;
Name :

API: Entity: Sec___Twp__ _Rng___ Lease Type:
APL: Entity: Sec___Twp_ Rng__ lLease Type:
API: Entity: Sec___Twp__Rng___ Lease Type: .
API: Entity: Sec__ _Twp__ Rng___ Lease Type:
API: A Entity: Sec___Twp___Rng___ Lease Type:
API: : Entity: Sec___Twp__Rng Lease Type:

1.

Lo
os

Lo
éfi
Lo
Yo

OPERATOR CHANGE DOCUMENTATION

(Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or other legal documentation has been received from fgrmgr
operator (Attach to this form). 4,0/ 7 2.9])

(Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or other legal documentation has been received from new operator
(Attach to this form). %/;,24,757

The Department of Commerce has been contacted if the new operator above is not. currently
operating any wells in Utah. Is company -registered with the state? (yes/no) “If

yes, show company file number:

(For Indian and Federal Hells ONLY) The BLM has been contacted regarding this change
(attach Telephone Documentation Form to this report). Make note of BLM status in
comments section of this form. Management review of Federal and Indian well operator

changes should take place prior to completion of steps 5 through 9 below.

Changes have been entered in the Oil and Gas Information System (Wang/IBM) for each well
listed above. /429,

Cardex file has been updated for each well listed above.(%ﬂf#%?
Well file labels have been updated for each well listed above.[%;#ﬁ]

Changes have been included on the monthly "Operator, Address, and Account Changes" memo
for distribution to State Lands and the Tax,Commission.(f¢34¢7 .

A folder has been set up for the Operator Change file, and a copy of this page has been
placed there for reference during routing and processing of the original documents

— OVER -



-

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (CONTINUED) Initial each item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable.

ENTITY REVIEH
2£Zl. (Rule R615-8-7) Entity assigaments have been reviewed for all wells listed above. Were
entity changes made? (yes/ . (If entity assignments were changed, attach copies of

Form 6, Entity Action Form)~

ﬁ%{ 2. State Lands and the Tax Commission have been notified through normal procedures of
entity changes.

BOND VERIFICATION (Fee wells only)
%é;ﬁ (Rule R615-3-1) The new operator of any fee lease well listed above has furnished a

) 221: proper bond.

2. A copy of this form has been placed in the new and former operators' bond files.

__ 3. The former operator has requested a release of liability from their bond (yes/no) __
Today's date 19 . If yes, division response was made by letter

dated 19

LEASE INTEREST OHNER NOTIFICATION RESPONSIBILITY

ﬁZ&;l, (Rule R615-2-10) The former operator/lessee of any fee lease well listed above has been
notified by letter dated 19 , of their responsibility to notify any

4 berson with an interest in such lease of the change of operator. Documentation of such
77 ¥/5¢ notification has been requested.

4@@n2. Copies of documents have been sent to State Lands for changes involving State leases.

FILMING

E N\ - (. :
Kﬁ?jl. A1l attachments to this form have been microfiimed. Date:__513¢9?/?} 1 /7 19;Zéél-

FILING
1. Copies of all attachments to this form have been filed'in each well file.

__ 2. The original of this form and the original attachments have been filed in the Operator
Change file.

COMMENTS

Wttole _ Blae [6120“Nil- ey dg W /w/. )
0% _bla /4,0;*1/. 5-2L9L.

WE71/34-35



UNITE’I’ATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals

o
——

‘ FORM APPROVED
Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
Expires: March 31, 1983

5. Lease Designation.and Serial No.
1420H621704

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

VTE

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE

7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

1. Type of Well
Qil Gas

[XQwen [Jwen [Jother

8. Weil Name and No.

2. Name of Operator
Samson Resources Company

Ute 2-34Z2

9. APl Well No.

3. Address and Telephone No.
2 West 2nd Street, Tulsa, OK 74103 (918) 583-1791

43-013-31167

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)
SE/4 SW/4 SEC 34-1N-2W

Altamont-Wasatch

11. County or Parish, State

Duchesne, UT
12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

[X]Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans
Recompletion New Construction

DSubsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing
Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

[JFinat Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection
Other  Change of Operator Dispose Water
EffectiveJanuaryv 13, 1996 (Note: Report resuits of muitiple completion on Well

Compl or R pletion Report and Log form.}

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. if weli is
directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Effective January 18, 199€amson Resources Company is turning over operations of
this lease to Coastal 0il & . Gas Corp.

- T A .

PET.

AM. e

14. | hereby ceni@?:zi ing is t correct
Signed _\ %/» e Title Production Analyst __Date 1/17/96
This space/for Epderd ' »
(This space’st 5 BSSISTENT DITRICY MAY 23 1990
Approved by” 77 Title fremanes paeeen e Date

S e

Conditions of approval, i any.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agericy of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements
of representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction. .

*See Instruction on Reverse Side

2 R-TE S ™



Form 8160~5 UNKTED STATES
{June /980) DEPAR OF THE INTERIOR '
, BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a differe/n} reseryoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" — for such proposals /{‘9 '

FORM APPROVED
Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
Expires: March 31, 1983

o

Lease Designation and Serial No.

14—20—H62 —1704

6. If Indian, Alottee or Tribe Name

Ute

<2 ;: -"'ﬁ = e
KRN
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE Gty

7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

1. Type of Well

Ol Well D Gas Well D Other

8. Well Name and No.

Ute #2-3472

2. Name of Operator

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

9. API Weli No,

43-013-31167

3. Address and Telephone No.

P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201 -0749

(303) 573-4455

10. Field and Poal, Or Exploratory Area

Altamont

4. Location of Weli (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., Or Survey Description)

SE/SW Section 34—~TIN—-R2W

11. County or Parish, State

Duchesne County, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

D Notice of intent
Subsequent Report

D Abandonment
I:! Recompletion
D Plugging Back
D Casing Repair
D Altering Casing

omer Change of Operator

D Final Abandonment Notice

D Change of Plans
D New Construction

D Non—Routine Fracturing

D Water Shut-0Off

D Conversion to Injection

D Dispose Water

(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well
Compietion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of staring any proposed work. If well is directionally

drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and tru vertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Please be advised that effective January 18, 1996, Samson Resources Company turned over operatorship of the subject well to
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation. All operations will be covered by the following nationwide bonds:

State of Utah:  #102103
BLM: #U605382-9 P T,
BIA: #114066—-A YT g A sl I

o W
S g,u
{
§
[
1

s A T
c(‘
rl
'
h

14, | hereby certify thatghe foregoing is true and correct
SIgneP\} ;; M) M)

“tite Environmental & Safety Analyst pate

02/16/96

’Sheilagremer i
/ 2S5 DISTRICT

oy parripmag N
RIRLIACIY POIAOT AT

s it e wuw b amubimn

MAY 2 3 8%

Date

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, ficticious or fraudulent statements or

representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse Side



United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Vernal District Office
170 South 500 East Phone: (801) 781-4400
IN REPLY REFER TO: Vernal, Utah 84078-2799 Fax: (801) 781-4410
3162.3
uT08438
May 22, 1996 ATETRY O
g E (® Tu’% H Y e 11\}
U
R
MAY 31 193 |~
Coastal Oil & Gas Corp.
Attn: Sheila Bremer DIV. OF OIL. GAS & MINING
P. O. Box 749 , GAS & G
Denver CO 80201-0749
Uz.0)3- 31107

Re:  Well No. Ute 2-34Z72
SESW, Sec. 34, T1N, R2W
Lease 14-20-H62-1704
Duchesne County, Utah

Dear Ms. Bremer:

This correspondence is in regard to the Sundry Notice submitted requesting a change in
operator for the referenced well. Afier a review by this cffice, the change in operator request
is approved. Effective immediately, Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation is responsible for all
operations performed on the referenced well. All liability will now fall under your bond, a
$150,000 BIA Nationwide Bond, for all operations conducted on the referenced well on the

leased land.

If you have any other questions concerning this matter, please contact Margie Herrmann or
Pat Sutton of this office at (801) 789-1362.

Sincerely,

Z

Howard B. Cleavinger I
Assistant District Manager for
Minerals Rescurces

cc: Samson Resources Company
BIA

- t - -~y H . oo ‘ 1
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S aa ol e G sen S e a e
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Form 31605 Q\IITED STATES
(June 190) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" - for such proposals

FORM APPROVED
Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
Expires: March 31, 1993

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

14-20-H62-1704

6. If Indian, Alottee or Tribe Name

Ute

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE

7. TfUnit or CA, Agreement Designation

1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.
Oil Well D Gas Well D Other Ute #2-3472
2. Name of Operator 9. APTWellNo.

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

43-013-31167

3. Address and Telephone No.

P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455

10." Field and Pool, Or Exploratory Area

Altamont

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R, M., Or Survey Description)

SE/SW Section 34-TIN-R2W

11. County or Parish, State

l Duchesne County, UT

12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent

D Subsequent Report

D Abandonment

L__] Recompletion

[:J Plugging Back

D Casing Repair

D Altering Casing

oter Perf & Acidize

D Final Abandonment Notice

D Change of Plans

D New Construction
[:J Non-Routine Fracturing

[ ] water shut-off

[:J Conversion to Injection

q Dispose Water
(NOTE:  Report resuits of multiple completion on Well

Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13.  Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally

drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and tru vertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Please see attached workover procedure for work to be performed in the subject well.

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

14. Thereby certify that the fo egoing is true and correct
Signed \Z%LMW\/

Tt _Environmental & Safety Analyst

Dat 09/24/96

Sheéila Bremer

(This space for Federai or State office use)

APPROVED BY Titl

Dat

Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes ft a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, ficticious or fraudulent statements or

representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse Side



UTE 2-342
Section 34 TIN R2W
Altamont Field
Duchesne Co. Utah

PROCEDURE:

1.

2.

10.

MIRU PU. NDWH NUBOP

MIRU Wireline Co. RIH and freept 2-7/8" tbg. Cut tbg if possible above pump
cavity @ approx 13,680'. POOH w/tbg.

RIH w/4-1/2" overshot w/1.9" grapple on 2-7/8" tbg. Latch onto parted heat
string. Recover enough so bottom perf @ 12,775 can be shot. POOH

MIRU Wireline Co. RIH w/CIBP and set @ 13,000'. PT plug to 1000 psi. Cap
w/2 sx cmt.

Perforate the following interval w/a 4" ¢sg gun loaded w/3 JSPF, 120 degree
phasing,

11,419-12,775' 56' 168 holes
Tie into OWP CBL dated 10-15-86 for depth control.

RIH wiretr pkr and 2-7/8" tbg. Hydrotest tbg GIH to 8500 psi. Set pkr @
11,350". PT csgto 1000 psi.

MIRU Dowell to acidize interval from 11,419-12,775 w/5000 gals 15% HCL per
attached treatment schedule. MTP 9000 psi. Swab back load.

Rise pkr, POOH wrtbg. Depending on results of swab test, the well may be
returned to production, or the workover will continue and either a CIBP or
RBP will be set @ 13,000,

MIRU Wireline Co. To perforate the following Green River intervals w/a 4" csg
gun loaded w/3 JSPF, 120 degree phasing.

9931-11,314' 134' 402 holes
Tie into OWP CBL dated 10-15-86 for depth control.

RIH wiretr pkr on 2-7/8" tbg. Set pkr @ 9900'. PT csg to 1000 psi.



Page 2/2-3472

11.

12.

13.

MIRU Dowell to acidize interval from 9931-1 1,314
attached treatment schedule. MTP 9000 psi.

Swab back load and test.

w/12,000 gals 15% HCL per

RIH w/R-3 pkr, pump cavity on 2-7/8" tbg. Set pkr @ 9850'. Drop SV. Drop

pump. Return well to production.




GREATER ALTAMONT FIELD
UTE #2-3422
Section 34 - TIN - R2W
Duchesne County, Utah

Upper Wasatch Perforation Schedule

Welex | O.W.P. j Welex II O.W.P.
- Dual Induction ' Cement Bond ; Dual Induction : Cement Bond
__Run #1 (8/14/86) | Run #1(10/15/86) Run #1 (8/14/86) i Run #1(10/15/86)
11419 | 11,409 12,332 12,324
‘ 11,421 11,411 12,334 12,326
| 11,424 11,414 12,336 12,328
{_ 11,441 11,431 12,338 12,330
i 11,443 | 11,433 | 12,345 ! 12,337
11,456 11,446 | 12,347 ! 12,339
11,462 11,452 12,349 % 12,341
é 11,483 | 11,473 12,357 12,349
. 11,644 | 11,634 12,359 12,351
11,657 | 11,647 12,361 12,353
11,659 11,649 12,363 12,355
11,661 11,651 12,395 12,387
11,665 11,655 12,412 12,404
| 11,666 11,656 12,418 f 12,410
11,678 11,670 12,471 i 12,462
11,782 11,773 12,473 J 12,464
11,784 11,775 12,477 ! 12,468
11,913 11,904 12,479 | 12,470
11,921 11,912 12,741 f 12,733
: 11,923 11,914 12,743 12,735
: 11,925 ! 11,916 12,745 12,737
Q 11,939 | 11,930 12,752 12,744
| 12,293 | 12,285 12,759 12,751
12,295 | 12,287 12,765 12,757
12,297 12,289 12,767 12,759
12,299 12,291 12,769 ‘ 12,761
12,301 ! 12,293 12,773 | 12,765
12,303 | 12,295 12,775 i 12,767
56 ZONES
S.H. Laney 9/9/96

Z22-34P2 WK4



GREATER ALTAMONT FIELD
UTE #2-34Z2
Section 34-TIN - R2wW
Duchesne County, Utah

Lower Green River Perforation Schedule

Welex OW.pP, . Welex O.W.P. . Welex ~ OWP,
Duaiind  Cem Bd Dualind  Cem Bd . Dualind | CemBd ;
Run#1  Run#1 © Run#!  Run# . Run#1 | Run#t
—(814/86) _(1015/86) | (8/14/86) (10/15/86) | _ (8/14/86) | (10/15/86) |
9,931 9,917 10,393 10,380 ! _10.768 ' 10,756
9,935 9,922 {10,403 10,391 L 10772 10,760
9,940 9,927 | 10,405 10,393 . 10,774 10,762
L9942 9929 10410 10,398 '_10.776 10,764
. 9,951 9,937 [ 10,414 10,402 | 10,781 | 10,769
T 9,053 9938 [ 10416 10,404 | 10,785 10,773
9,955 9,941 10,433 10,421 | 10,796 | 10,784
9,960 9,946 10,435 10,423 10801 | 10,789
9.962 9,943 10,439 10,427 _10.810__| 10,799
9,964 9,950 10,441 10,429 10,812 10,801
9,975 9,961 10,445 10,433 10817 . 10,806
9,979 9,965 " 10.447 10,435 ;10840 | 10,828
9,983 9,969 |__10,453 10,440 10844 10,832
i 9,987 9,974 i_10,465 10,453 i 10848 ' 10,836
9,903 9,980 10,481 10,469 10,856 10,845
' 9,999 9985 | 10483 10,471 |_10.858 | 10,847
| 10,007 9,993 |__10,489 10,477 | 10868 | 10,857
{10,012 9,998 10,504 10,492 | 10,870 | 10,859
[ 10,014 10,000 | 10,517 10505 [ 10876 | 10.865
"_10.016 10,002 10,520 10,508 :_10,885 | 10,874
10,193 10,180 10,532 10,520 11037 11,026
10,195 10,182 I 10,534 10,522 11,045 11,034
{10,200 10,188 {10,549 10,537 11,049 11,038
|__10.204 10,192 | 10,558 10,546 11051 11,040
| 10,211 10,198 10,560 10,548 11053 11,082
10,213 10,200 10,562 10,550 11085 11,054
10,267 10,255 "~ 10,567 10,555 11,073 11,062
"~ 10.269 10,257 10,571 10,559 11,134 11,123
10.271 10,259 10,577 10,565 11138 11,427
10,277 10,265 10,580 10,568 11,145 | 11,134
10279 10,267 [ 10,588 10,576 11147 11,136
10,292 10,279 10,593 10,581 P 11,151 11,144
| 10,294 10,281 10,602 10,590 11,153 11,143
| 10,296 10,283 10,604 10,5692 11,162 11,152
I_10.315 10,303 {10,608 10,596 11204 | 11,193
710,321 10,309 [ 10,619 10,607 11212 11,201
10,323 10,311 10,626 10,614 | 11217 11,207
10,328 10,316 10,629 10,617 | 11225 | 11,215
10,335 10,322 | _10,636 10,624 11229 11,219
| 10,337 10,324 10,642 10,630 11,235 11,225
. 10,339 10,326 10,650 10,638 11269 11,259
r 10,344 10,331 10,652 10,640 11,285 11,274
10,354 10,341 | 10,658 10,646 I 11,291 11,280
| 10.375 10,363 10,660 10,648 11,314 11,304
| 10,386 10,374 10,662 10,650
134 ZONES

S.H. Laney 9/9/96

22-34P2A . WK4



Well Name: Ute #2-3472 Date: 9/10/96
Upper Interval
Fluid Stage 3% KCI Gelled 10 ppg Brine] 15 % Acid Vol Ball Sealers
Description | # (Gal) (Gal) (Gal) (#. Sg)
Pad 1 2,000
Acid 2 2,500 125
Diverter 3 2,500
Acid 4 4,500 225
Diverter 5 1,500
Acid 6 5,000 250
Flush 7 4,300
Totals (gals): 6,300 4,000 12,000 600, 1.1 S.G.
(bbls): 150 95 286

Gelled Saltwater to contain: _1/2_ppg BAF




Well Name: Ute #2-3472 Date: 9/10/96

Lower Interval

Fluid Stage 3% KCI Gelled 10 ppg Brine] 15 % Acid Vol. | Ball Sealers
Description # (Gal) (Gal) (Gal) (#. Sq)
Pad 1 2,300 I
Acid 2 5,000 250
Flush 3 3,600 \
Totals (gals): 5,900 5,000 250, 1.1 S.G. ‘
(bbls): 140 119

Gelled Saltwater to contain:  _1/2_ppg BAF

B S et = e - . — - o — A o v mm —vmr —
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Form 3160-5 @Rl TED STATES . FORM APPROVED

. {June 15905 DEPART T OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
s BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993
5. Lease Designation and Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 14-20-H62-1704
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. IfIndian, Alottee or Tribe Name
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" - for such proposals
Ute
7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE

1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.

Oil Well D Gas Well D Other Ute #2-3472
2. Name of Operator 9. API Weli No.

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-013-31167
3. Address and Telephone No. 10. Field and Pool, Or Exploratory Area

P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455 Altamont
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., Or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, State

SE/SW Section 34-TIN-R2W

Duchesne County, UT
12, CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent D Abandonment Change of Plans
D Recompletion D New Construction

Subsequent Report D Plugging Back D Non-Routine Fracturing

[ ] casing Repair [ ] water shutor

D Finat Abandonment Notice D Altering Casing D Conversion to Injection
other Perf & Acidize @ Dispose Water
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well

Completion or Recompletion Repont and Log form.)
13.  Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all perlinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionaily
drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and tru vertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Please see attached chronological history for work performed in the subject well.

14. 1 hereby certify that the fofegoing is frue and correct
Signed %@M”ﬂﬁf{ Tt Environmental & Safety Analyst  Dat 11/25/96

[4
Sheila Bremer
(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY Titl Dat
Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and wilifuily to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, ficticious or fraudulent statements or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

[ 7 /23 . 7/% X e ﬁ!—/ g /¢ 7 *See Instruction on Reverse Side
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COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

UTE #2-34Z2 (PERF & ACIDIZE)
ALTAMONT FIELD
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

WI: 86.7% ANR  AFE:

TD: 15,990' PBTD: 15,061’

5" LINER @ 13,784'-15,990'
PERFS: 14,121'-15,057'
CWC(MS$): 185.7

10/3/96 POOH.
MIRU. Pump 350 bbis hot down tbg. ND WH, NU BOPs. RU cutters & freepoint, 50% free @
7500". POOH, make up chem cutter. RIH, cut off @ 11,997', top of WL tools. POOH. Work tbg

out of hole, made 3072 hrs. Tbg came free, POOH. EOT 11,590". CC: $4731.
10/4/96 RIH w/OS.

POOH w/27” 7 cut off jt (14.70). PU 5%” OS w/2'%” grapple, BS, jars, 6 DC. RIH, sticking out

on wax, EOT 3000'. CC: $14,496.
10/5/96 Work through wax.

RIH w/OS, stack out on wax, pump down tbg w/150 bbls hot water. Spot condensate 50 bbls, flush

to end of tbg w/40 bbls treated prod water. EOT 6007'. CC: $22,691.
10/6/96 Drig on wax.

Try to work down through wax - no headway. POOH, LD jars & BS, PU 6" bit, RIH, RU swivel.

Drig on wax made 3'/3 hrs. EOT 6010'. CC: $26,861.
10/7/96 Prep to run fishing tool.

Drlg on scale from 6010' to 6016’ (6')/6 hrs. Last 1' drld had evidence of metal cuttings in returns.
POOH w/6" drag bit - evidence that bit had been down alongside of 1.90" OD fish.  CC: $31,196.

10/8/96 Work & jar on fish.
WOO, call for tools. PU mousetrap, RIH on 5% WP, tag fish @ 6016', work over top of fish. Jar
on fish %2 hr, someting broke. RIH 180/, try to relatch, could not. POOH, door on mousetrap broke.
RIH w/5%” OS w/2'4” grapple, latch fish, jar & work stuck tbg. Jar for 2 hrs w/15,000# over string
wt - no movement. CC: $35,841.

10/9/96 PU swivel, try to latch fish.
Work & jar on fish @ 66,000-15,000 over string wt - jar for one hour, tbg parted. POOH, LD 147
jts 1.9" tbg - left 71 jts in hole, fish top @ 10,696". Make up 5%” OS w/2%”" grapple. BS, jars.
RIH, tag fish @ 10,696, try to work over - could not. Will PU swivel in a.m. CC: $40,345.

10/10/96 POOH w/fish.
PU swivel, work over fish @ 10,696'. Latch on & jar on fish, jar @ 90,000-18,000 over string wt,
jar 2 hrs, no movement. RIH w/freepoint, unable to get into fish. RIH w/spud bar, found tight spot
@ 12,020'. RIH w/freepoint, free @ 11,991". RIH wistring shot to 11,959, fired, tbg came free
deeper. CC: $50,602.

10/11/96 POOH w/274",
POOH w/fish, LD 43 jts 1.9" thg. PU 5%” OS w/2%"” grapple, BS, jars, 6-4%” DC. RIH w/2%”
tbg, tagged fish @ 11,136, 861" higher than 27" was cut off (@ 11,997"). Work OS, could not get
down, would not latch. POOH w/274”. CC: $59,016.

10/12/96 POOH w/27%" thg,
Finish POOH, LD 27" fishing tools - no marks on grapple & no fish. PU 5%” OD OS wR2%”
grapple. 4" ODx2!4” ID tbg jars, 4" ODx2'2” ID bumper sub. RIH on 27%” tbg (374 jts), tag 1.90
tbg fish top @ 11,136', work down over fish top, pulled over 10,0004. Came free, PU 2,000-3,000#
extra wt. POOH w/27%” tbg, EOT @ 8945". CC: $64,547.

10/13/96 Work fish.
EOT @ 8945'. POOH w/274” tbg & 1.90" tbg fish tools. LD 28 jts 1.90" tbg (854"). RIH w/2%”
grapple, 5% OD OS (3.40"), 4%” OD jars (10.90"), 4%” OD bumper sub (5.64"). 6-4%” OD DCs
(179.32"), 4%” OD accelerator (10.64") & 378 jts 2%” tbg. Latch fish top @ 11,996". String wt
74,000, work fish @ 104,000 (30,000# over). CC: $70,822.
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COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

UTE #2-34Z2 (PERF & ACIDIZE)
ALTAMONT FIELD
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

WI: 86.7% ANR  AFE:

10/14/96

10/15/96

10/16/96

10/17/96

10/18/96

10/18-19/96

10/21/96

10/22/96

10/23/96

10/24/96

RIH w/1" sink bar on WL.

Jarring @ 120,000#, 35,000# over string wt - no movement. RU Cutters, RIH w/freepoint OD 1-
11/16", tag @ 12,031', 100% free @ 12,028'. POOH. PU 174" OS w/1'4” grapple. RIH, tag @
12,031, try to get on sinker bars - could not. POOH, looks like did not get to sinker bar. RIH
w/0S, 174"x1%”, tag @ 12.031', POH w/WL. Found OS eggshaped w/small piece (1"x%"x%")
broken off bowl. CC: $76,340.

POOH w/27%4” & fishing tool.

RIH w/1" sinker bar, tag @ 12,031, try to work through, could not, POOH. Try to back off
manually, try four times, unsuccessful. Rel OS, POOH w/320 jts 27", flush tbg four times (ciean
tbg to hydrotest back in hole). EOT 1876'. CC: $84,260.

Repair rig.
POOH w/60 jts 27%” N-80 tbg. LD 4%” int, 6-4%" drill collars, 4%4” jars, 4%” bumper sub, 5%” OS
wi2%4” grapple. RU Cutter WL, set 7" CIBP @ 11,985'. Fill csg w/30 bbls tested to 1000 psi -
good test. Perf w/3 SPF, 120° phasing, 4" gun:
Run 1: 11,980'-11,834', 20 ft, 60 holes, psi 0, FL @ sfc
Run 2: 11,828'-11,665', 20 ft, 60 holes, psi 0, FL @ sfc
Run 3: 11,661'-11,469", 20 ft, 60 holes, psi 0, FL @ sfc
Run 4: 11,466'-11,409', 11 ft, 33 holes, psi 0, FL @ sfc
Total: 11,980'-11,409', 71t, 213 holes.
RD Cutter WL. RU 4-Star, PU 7" HD pkr & 5 jts 274”. Rig broke down, SD for repair.
CC: $107,350.
Hydrotest in hole.
Finish rig repair. Prep to RIH w/pkr.

Prep to acidize.
RU & hydrotest 27" to 8500#. RIH w/7" PK pkr on 2%” tbg. Find 3 collar leaks. Set 7" HD pkr
@ 11,056, test to 500#, good test. RD 4 Star hydrotester. Drain pump & lines. CC: $113,393.

No activity.

Swabbing.

MIRU Dowell. Acidize perfs from 11,980'-11,409' w/6500 gals 15% HCL + 320 1.1 BS. MTP
90004, ATP 8500#, MTR 18 BPM, ATR 12 BPM. ISIP 5000#, 15 min SIP 4050%4. Had excellent
diversion, 315 BLTR. RD Dowell, well fowed 75 bbls in 1/4 hrs w/50 psi. Well stop flowing. RU
& swab, IFL @ sfc, FFL 9400'. Swab 6 hrs, rec 186 BW, PH 4.0, 11 BPHentry.  CC: $137,849.

POOH w/274”, 7" pkr.
Swab, IFL 5700', FFL 10,000". Rec 44 BW, no oil, PH 5.0/7hrs. Rel pkr, POOH to 8200'".
CC: $141,174.

Perf.

POOH w/pkr, LD pkr. RU Cutters, RIH w/7" CIBP, set @ 11,330". Prep to perf, test CIBP 1000#,
ok. CC: $143,439.
Swabbing.

RU Cutter WL, perfs from 11,314'-9931 w/4" gun, 3 SPF, 120° phasing:

Run #1; 11,314'-11,053', 20 ft, 60 holes, 0 psi, FL sfc.

Run #2: 11,051'-10,781", 20 ft, 60 holes, 0 psi, FL sfc.

Run #3: 10,776'-10,580", 20 ft, 60 holes, 0 psi, FL sfc.

Run #4: 10,577'-10,441", 20 ft, 60 holes, 0 psi, FL sfc.

Run #5: 10,439'-10,315', 20 ft, 60 holes, 0 psi, FL sfc.

Run #6: 10,296'-9993", 20 ft, 60 holes, 0 psi, FL sfc.

Run #7: 9987"-9931", 14 f, 42 holes, 0 psi, FL sfc.

Total: 11,314'-9931", 134 ft, 402 holes, 0 psi, FL sfc.

RD Cutter WL. PU & RIH w/7" HD pkr & 320 jts 274", set pkr @ 9903'. PT csg to 10004, good
test, bled off pressure, drain pump & line. CC: $170,679.



UTE #2-34Z2 (PERF & ACIDIZE)
ALTAMONT FIELD
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

WI: 86.7% ANR  AFE: 26605

10/25/96

10/26/96

10/27/96

10/28/96

10/29/96

10/30/96

10/31/96

11/1/96

1172/96

11/3/96

Page 3
COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY
RU Dowell.
Check psi on tbg - 0 psi. RU swab, made 21 swab runs/11 hrs. Swab back 160 bbis - 155.5 BW,
4.5 BO. IFL sfc, FFL 7500, 16 BPH entry, 5% oil in last 4 hrs. CC: $173,979.
Swabbing.

MIRU Dowell, acidize perfs from 9931'-11,314' w/12000 gals 15% HCL + diverter. MTP 9040#,
ATP 8100#, MTR 28 BPM, ATR 25 BPM. ISIP 2600#, 15 min SIP 1850#. Had fair diversion, 569
BLTR. RD Dowell. Well flowing 67 bbls in 2 hrs. RU & swab, IFL sfc, FFL 500'. Rec 42 bbis
swabbing, flowing 67 bbls 100% water. 8 runs w/ball catcher, rec 472 1.1 b.s. in 4 hrs, swab 2 hrs,

flush tbg w/60 bbls treated prod water. CC: $205,202.
Swab.

Swab, IFL sfc, FFL 4200'. Rec 183 BW, 9 BO, PH 4.0, 10% oil cut. Swab 9% hrs. EPH 20 bbls,
150 BLTR. CC: $208,697.

Flow testing.
SITP 450#. Flowed 84 BO, 56 BW/10 hrs, FTP 200#. Tried to flow to battery, FL froze up.
CC: $211,122.

POOH wi/kill string, PU BHA.
Flow test, flwd 115 bbls in 4 hrs, 70 % oil cut, FTP 70#. Rel pkr @ 9903'. POOH. EOT @ 1575".
CC: $213,967.

Circ out thg, test csg.
POOH w/pkr. RU & hydrotest pump cavity to 10,0004. RIH on 274" tbg testing to 8500#. Set pkr
@ 9848', pump cavity @ 9809'. ND BOP, NU WH. Test WH to 5000#4, ok. Drop SV.

CC: $220,467.
On production.
Circ tbg w/100 bbls treated prod water, test tbg & csg to 20004 - ok. NU flow line, RDMO, place
on production. Pmpd 83 BO, 143 BW, 40 MCF, PP 3000#, 21 hrs. CC: $238,385.

Pmpd 90 BO, 184 BW, 74 MCF, PP 2300#, 24 hrs.
Pmpd 71 BO, 83 BW, 25 MCF, PP 3250#, 14 hrs, down 10 hrs - low discharge.

Pmpd 145 BO, 231 BW, 62 MCF, PP 34004, 24 hrs.
Prior prod: 0 BO, 0 BW, 0 MCF (SI - uneconomic)

Final report,



« Form 31_?0-5

@A D STATES
- (June 1930) ‘

DEPART T OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" - for such proposals

FORM APPROVED
Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
Expires: March 31, 1993

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

14-20-H62-1704

6. if Indian, Alottee or Tribe Name

Ute Indian Tribe
7. IfUnit or CA, Agreement Designation
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE 9C140
1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.
Oil Well D Gas Well D Other Ute #2-3472
2. Name of Operator 9. AP Well No.

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

43-013-31167

3. Address and Telephone No.

P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455

10. Field and Pool, Or Exploratory Area

Altamont/Bluebell

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., Or Survey Description)

1957 FWL & 1223’ FSL

11. County or Parish, State

Section 33, TIN-R2W - Duchesne Co., UT
12, CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

D Notice of Intent
Subsequent Report

D Abandonment
D Recompletion
I:] Plugging Back

Casing Repair

D Altering Casing

D Final Abandonment Notice

other SWI Flowline installation

D Change of Plans

}:] New Construction
l:] Non-Routine Fracturing
‘:I Water Shut-Off

D Conversion to injection

Q{ Dispose Water
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well

Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13.  Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally

drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and tru vertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent to this work.y*

A 2" steel SWD flowline has been installed on the subject well. All applicable damage settlements have been made.

ECEIVIE|M

APR 28 1997

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MIIiNG

14. | hereby certify that the fore?in; is tm%‘/
Signed

Tt _Environmental & Safety Analyst

Dat 04/24/97

Sheila Bremer

{This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY Titl

Dat

Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, ficticious or fraudulent statements or

representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse Side
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e 3
Forly 3160-» UMD STATES FORM APPROVED
. (dane 198 DEPARTV @ OF THE INTERIOR . Budget Bureau No. 1004-0,35
= BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993
5. Lease Designation and Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 14-20-H62-1704
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or o deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. If Indian, Alottee or Tribe Name
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" - for such proposals
Ute Indian Tribe
7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE 9C140
1. Type of Well 8. Weli Name and No.
Oil Weil D Gas Well D Other Ute #2-3472
2. Name of Operator 9. API'Well No.
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-013-31167
3. Address and Telephone No. 10. Field and Pool, Or Exploratory Area
P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455 Altamont/Bluebell
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., Or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, State
1957' FWL & 1223' FSL
Section 33, TIN-R2W Duchesne Co., UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

D Notice of intent D Abandonment D Change of Plans
l:' Recompletion D New Construction

Subsequent Report D Plugging Back D Non-Routine Fracturing

D Casing Repair I:] Water Shut-Off

(:l Final Abandonment Notice D Altering Casing D Conversion to Injection

Other Rgd Eump Qonversion gr Dispose Water
N

E: Report results of multiple compietion on Well
Completion or R ion Report and Log form.)
13.  Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionaily

drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and tru vertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Please see the attached chronological history for work performed on the subject well.

ECEIVES

|
|
MAY 14 1997 ||| ),
!
|

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

)
14 Thereby ceriify that the forgfojng is tme%
Signed \5 §M Tt Environmental & Safety Analyst  pat 05/12/97

Sheila Bremer
(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY Titl Dat
Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.8.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfuily to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, ficticious or fraudulent statements or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse Side

Wo % . Crdidt b / 9



Page 4
COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY
UTE #2-34Z2 (ROD PUMP CONVERSION)
ALTAMONT FIELD
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT
WI: 86.68%  AFE:27033/34
TD: 15,990' PBTD: 14,266’
5" LINER @ 15,990
PERFS: 9931'-11,314'
CWC(MS3): 126.0
4/21/97 RIH w/BHA on 27",
MIRU. ND WH, NU BOP. Rel R-3 pkr, flush tbg w/30 bbls TPW. POOH w/BHA, LD BHA. PU
new BHA. CC: 3$3725.
4/22/97 RIH w/1" rods.
RIH w/BHA on 274" tbg, set 7" TAC @ 9828, SN @ 11,312, w/28,000# tens, xo fo rods. ND
BOP, NU WH. PU 1%” pump, test, PU new rod string, RIH, EOR 7700". CC: §7991.
4/23/97 On production.
PU 30 74" rods, 139 1" rods. Seated pump @ 11,295, filled tbg w/5 bbls, tested to 1000#, good
test. RD, turn well to production. CC: $59,031.
Pmpd 13 BO, 166 BW, 0 MCF, 4.8 SPM, 14 hrs.
4/24/97 Pmpd 24 BO, 305 BW, 34 MCF, 4.8 SPM.
4/25/97 Pmpd 150 BO, 176 BW, 60 MCF, 4.8 SPM.
4/26/97 Pmpd 258 BO, 123 BW, 60 MCF, 4.8 SPM.

Prior production: Pmpd 135 BO, 90 BW, 51 MCF.
Final report.



STATE UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOQURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

2]

. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

£, 1F INDIAN ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE MAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

~

- UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do ttol usa Lhis forny for proposals lo diill new wells, siguificanlly deepen exisling wells below curcent bottem-haole depih, reenter plugyged wells, or lo
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

b TYPEORWELL ol weLl ] GASWELL [ ] OTHER
Exhibit "A"
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
E1l Paso Production 0il & Gas Company
3. ADDRESS OF OFERATOR: PHONE NUMUER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
8 South 1200 East cnv Vernal state Utahzir 84078 435-789-4433

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOQTAGES AT SURFACE: ' S . .", : B o - V COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: . - ' STATE:

UTAH

1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
DEEPEN

ACIDIZE REPENRFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
[[1 woTice oF meENT
{Submit in Duplicale) SIDETRACK TO REPAIR 'WELL

ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT

Approximate dale work will start: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDOR

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VEMT OR FLARE

D SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL

(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Dale of work 60mpielion:
RECLAMATION OF WELL.SITE

HO0000000

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS otver:_Name Change

Uhbhoooooo
ooooocoono

CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dales, depths, volumes, etc.
As a result of the merger between The Coastal Corporation and a wholly owned

subsidary of El Paso Energy Corporation, the name of Coastal 0il & Gas Corporation
has been changed to El Paso Production 0il & Gas Company effective March 9, 2001.

See Exhibit "A"

Bond # %00JU0708

' Coastal 0il & Gas Corporation
NAME (PLEASE PRINY] ohn T Elzner TITLE Vice President

7‘%— onte L4 15 -0/

\\—34<<E1 Paso Pudduction Oil & Gas Company
HAME (PLEASE PRIT John TC-EJ(zmer mme | vice President

- 7
SIGHATURE )Q—l 7 /%\\” one  Cb /5 -2/
[ ] [ ]
(This space (O(W ~— o "y o en
RECEIVED

JUN % 2001

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND MINING

SIGHATURE

{5/2000} {Sea Inslruclions on Reverse Slde)




7 ‘ State of Delaware ‘

Office of the Secretary of State

PAGE 1

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF
DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATTACHED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT
COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT OF "COASTAL OIL & GAS
CORPORATION", CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "COASTAL OIL & GAS
CORPORATION" TO "EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY", FILED IN

THIS OFFICE ON THE NINTH DAY OF MARCH, A.D. 2001, AT 11 O’CLOCK

.M.

BT

DIVISION DF
Hi GAS AND sainar

Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary of State

0610204 8100 AUTHENTICATION: 1061007

010162788 DATE: 04-03-01



10:14 FAX 713 420 4@ CORP. LAY DEPT. @o03/003 _

03708/01

CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT
OF¥
CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION (the “Company™), a corporation
organized and existing under agd by virtue of the General Corporation Law of the State of
Delaware, DOES HEREBY CERTIFY: ,

FIRST: That the Board of Directors of the Company, by the unanimous
written consent of its members, filed with the minutes of the Board, adopted a resolution
proposing and declaring advisable the following amendment to the Certificate of
Incorporation of the Company:

RESOLVED that it is deemed advisable that the Certificate of
Incorporation of this Company be amended, and that said Certificate of
Incorporation be so emended, by changing the Article thereof numbered
“FIRST.” 50 that, as amended, said Article shall be and read as follows;

“FIRST. The name of the corporation is El Paso Production Ojl & Gas
Company.”

SECOND: That in lien of a meeting and vote of stockholders, the
stockholders entitled to vote have given unanimous written consent to said amendment in
accordance with the provisions of Section 228 of the General Corporation Law of the
State of Delaware.

THIRD: That the aforesaid amendment was duly adopted in accordance with
the applicable provisions of Sections 242 and 228 of the General Corporation Law of the
State of Delaware,

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, said COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
has caused this certificate to be signed on its behalf by a Vice President and attested by an
Assistant Secretary, this 9th day of March 2001.

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
MW
- David L. Siddal]
Vice President

Attest:

STATE OF DELAWARE
SECRETARY OF STATE
DIVISION OF CORPORATIONS

e el vl AW Tl ! D 11:00 AM 03/09,/2001
Y by E..@Li‘vf E: o Lo116394 = 0610204
K 19 2001
DIVISION OF

JIL, GAS AND MINING



United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT o g, e o g e
Utah State Office REQ = iVED
P.O. Box 45155 _
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155 JUL 1 2 2001
DIVISION OF

In Reply Refer To: OIL, GAS AND MINING

3106
UTSL-065841
(UT-924)
JUL 10 2001-
NOTICE

El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company : Oil and Gas
Nine Greenway Plaza :
Houston TX 77046-0095

Name Change Recognized

Acceptable evidence has been received in this office concerning the name change of Coastal Oil &
Gas Corporation into El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company with El Paso Production Oil & Gas
Company being the surviving entity.

For our purposes, the name change is recognized effective March 9, 2001.

The oil and gas lease files identified on the enclosed exhibit have been noted as to the name change.
The exhibit was compiled from a list of leases obtained from our computer program. We have not
abstracted the lease files to determine if the entities affected by this name change hold an interest in
the leases identified nor have we attempted to identify leases where the entitities are the operator on
the ground maintaining no vested recorded title or operating rights interests. We will be notifying
the Minerals Management Service and all applicable Bureau of Land Management offices of the
change by a copy of this notice. If additional documentation for changes of operator are required by
our Field Offices, you will be contacted by them.

If you identify additional leases in which the entities maintain an interest, please contact this office
and we will appropriately document those files with a copy of this Notice.



Due to the name change, the name of the principal/obligor on the bond is required to be changed
from Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation to El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company. You may
accomplish this either by consent of surety rider on the original bond or a rider to the original bond.

The bonds are held in Wyoming and Colorado.

! Opolonia L. AbeytaM

Acting Chief, Branch of
Minerals Adjudication

Enclosure
1. Exhibit of Leases (1 pp)

cc: Moab Field Office

Vemal Field Office
MMS, Reference Data Branch, MS3130, PO Box 5860, Denver CO 80217

EStaEv Ut DOGM; Attn: Jim Thompson (Ste. 1210), Box 145801, SLC UT 84114
Teresa Thompson (UT-922)
Joe Incardine (UT-921)



[ i Wy

m States Department of the In‘)r

BUREAU OF INDIAN AFFAIRS

Uintah and Ouray Agency
P. O. Box 130
988 South 7500 East
Fort Duchesne, Utah 84026-0130
Phone: (435) 722-4300 Fax: (435) 722-2323

IN REPLY REFER TO:

Minerals and Mining .
Phone: (435) 722-4310 August 16,2001

Fax: (435) 722-2809

El Paso Production Company
Attn: Elizabeth R. Williams
Nine Greenway Plaza
Houston, TX 77046-0995

Dear Mrs. Williams:

We are in receipt of the corporate documentation for the name change from Coastal Oil & Gas
Corporation to El Paso Production Oil and Gas Company. :

All documents appear to be in order, and the approval is hereby authorized to change all records,
including change of operator of certain oil and gas wells, Rights-of-Way, Communitization
Agreements, Oil and Gas Leases, Exploration and Development Agreements, etc. from Coastal
0il & Gas Corporation to “El Paso Production 0il and Gas Company”.

Approval of this name change is August 16, 2001, but effective on March 9, 2001. If you have
any questions, please do not hesitate to contact this office.

Respectfully,

Aéting Supérinténdent

RECEIVED
AUG 22 2001

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND MINING



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH 4-KAS
2.CDW / 5-LP /
3.JLT 6-FILE
Enter date after each listed item is completed
Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent
Operator Name Change (Only) X Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: ~ 3-09-2001

FROM: (01d Operator):

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION

Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721

HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995

Phone: 1-(713)-418-4635

Account N0230

TO: ( New Operator):

EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY

Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 RM 2975B

HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995

Phone: 1-(832)-676-4721

Account N1 845

CA No. Unit:

WELL(S)
API ENTITY [SECTWN |LEASE |WELL |WELL

NAME NO NO RNG TYPE TYPE | STATUS
COLTHARP 1-2771 (CA 96-65) 43-013-30151 (4700 27-0IN-01W |INDJAN |OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-30Z1  (CA 84705C) 43-013-30813 9405 30-0IN-01W |INDIAN |OW p
UTE TRIBAL 1-31 (CA 73509) 43-013-30278 4755 31-0IN-01W |INDIAN |OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-31A2 43-013-30401 1925 31-01S-02W {INDIAN |OW P
UTE 1-3272 43-013-30379 (1915 32-0IN-02W |INDIAN |OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-3372  (CA 9C-140) 43-013-30334 |1851 33-0IN-02W JINDIAN jOW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-33Z2  (CA 9C-140) 43-013-31111 10451 33-0IN-02W |INDIAN |OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-3472 43-013-31167 |10668 34-0IN-02W JINDIAN |OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-3572 43-013-31133 10483 35-01N-02W |INDIAN |OW P
JAMES POWELL 4 43-013-30071 (8302 19-018-02W JINDIAN |jOW P
MCELPRANG 1-31A1 (CA 96-50) 43-013-30190 (5425 31-01S-01W |INDIAN [OW S
LESLIE UTE 1-11A3 43-013-30893 19401 11-01S-03W |[INDIAN |[OW P
LBUTE 1-13A3 43-013-30894 {9402 13-01S-03W |INDIAN |OW P
LAUREN UTE 1-23A3 43-013-30895 19403 23-015-03W |INDIAN |OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-25A3 43-013-30370 1920 25-015-03W |INDIAN {OW p
UTE 2-25A3 43-013-31343 {11361 25-0185-03W |INDIAN |OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-26A3 43-013-30348 [1890 26-01S-03W |INDIAN |OW P
UTE 2-26A3 43-013-31340 |[11349 26-01S-03W JINDIAN (OW P
UTE 2-35A3 43-013-31292 ]11222 35-01S5-03W |INDIAN [OW P
UTE 3-35A3 43-013-31365 |11454 35-01S-03W |INDIAN |OW P
UTE UNIT 1-34A4 (CA 96-40) 42-012-30076 {1585 34-01S-04W [INDIAN |OW P
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 06/19/2001
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 06/19/2001

2

The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on:

06/21/2001



4. Is the new operator registered in the Stzg Utah: YES Business N‘: 608186-0143

5. IfNO, the operator was contacted contacted on: N/A

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: 08/16/2001

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator

for wells listed on: 07/10/2001

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA'): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: 08/16/2001

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,
for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A

DATA ENTRY:

1. Changes entered in the Qil and Gas Database on: 08/28/2001

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 08/28/2001

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: N/A

4. TFee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: N/A

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEDERAL BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

INDIAN BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond No.: 103601473

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond No: N/A

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on:

FILMING:
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on:

FILING:
1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been fitled in each well file on:

COMMENTS: Master list of all wells involved in operator change from Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation to El Paso

Production Oil and Gas Company shall be retained in the "Operator Change File".




.

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW
X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2012
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
IN3065- El Paso E&P Company, L.P. N3850- EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX. 77002 . Houston, TX. 77002
Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038 Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038
CA No. Unit: N/A
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNGJAPI NO ENTITY [LEASE TYPE|WELL [|WELL
NO TYPE STATUS
See Attached List |
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/25/2012
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/25/2012
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/27/2012
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 2114377-0181
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Yes
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: N/A
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 6/25/2012
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM N/A BIA Not Received

7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: N/A
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: Second Oper Chg

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Qil and Gas Database on: 6/29/2012
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/29/2012
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: N/A
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JU0705
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4, (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 6/29/2012

COMMENTS:

Disposal and Injections wells will be moved when UIC 5 is received.

El Paso.xis 6/29/2012




STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER'
Multiple Leases

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposgis.

7. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
7
OIL WELL GasWELL []  OTHER See Attached
Z. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. Attn: Maria Gomez
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana iy Houston srate VX 7 77002 (713) 997-5038 See Attached
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See Attached COUNTY:
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

[ acioize [ oeeeen [C] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

/] NoTICE OF INTENT

{Submit in Duplicate) M) auTER CASING [C] FracTURE TREAT [C] sipETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work wit start:. | [ ]  CASING REPAIR [] wnewconsTRuCTION [C] veEMPORARILY ABANDON

[T] cHance To PREVIOUS PLANS [C] oreraToR cHANGE "] vueinG REPAIR
[J cHance TuBING [] PLuG AND ABANDON [7] ventorFLARE

[0 sussequent RepoRT ] crance weLL NaME [J pLuceack [[] warer DisposaL

(Submit Original Form Only)
[J cHance weLL sTATUS [[] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [[] waTER sHuT-OFF
Date of work completion:

[[] comMmINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [_] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE /] orver: Change of
[ converT weLL TYPE [J RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Name/Operator

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please be advised that El Paso E&P Company, L.P. (current Operator) has changed names to EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
(new Operator) effective June 1, 2012 and that EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is considered the new operator of the attached
well locations.

EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease(s) for the operations conducted
upon leased lands. Bond coverage is provided by the State of Utah Statewide Blanket Bond No. 400JU0705, Bureau of Land
Management Nationwide Bond No. 103601420, and Bureau of Indian Affairs Nationwide Bond No. 103601473.

Frank W. Falle Frank W. Falleri
Vice President Sr. Vice President
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.

NAME (pLasm. Gomez mme Principal Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE 6 : M oave  0/22/2012

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED (» /29/30IQ JUN 25 2012
Roahed

(moobivis‘-on of 0“’ Gas and Mining - (See Instructions on Reverse Side) DIV.OF OIL, GAS & MINING

Earlene-Russell, Engineering Techiiiclan: ...
Rachet Modirm




El Paso E1 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E1 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

Well [Well
Well Name ___ |Sec 'TWP RNG |API Number Entity Lease Type Type |Status Conf
DWR 3-17C6 747 030S [060W 4301350070 14204621118 |OW __ APD _ [C
LAKEWOOD ESTATES 3-33C6 33 030S [060W 4301350127 1420H621328 OW APD |C
YOUNG 3-15A3 15 |010S [030W 4301350122 FEE OW |APD [C
WHITING 4-1A2 01 |010S [020W |4301350424 Fee oW |APD [C |
EL PASO 4-34A4 34 010S [040W 4301350720 Fee OW APD [C
YOUNG 2-2B1 02 020S |010W (4304751180 FEE OW APD C |
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-10B4 10 |020S [040W 4301350712 |18221 [Fee OW [DRL C |
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-26B4 26 |020S [040W 4301350714 |18432 [Fee OW |DRL € |
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-24B4 24 [020S |040W 4301350717 |18315 |Fee OW DRL C
Cook 4-14B3 - 14 [020S |030W 4301351162 |18449 |Fee OW [DRL [C
Peterson 4-22C6 22 |030S |060W 4301351163 18518 [Fee OW [DRL [C |
Lake Fork Ranch 4-14B4 14 020S [040W [4301351240 (99999 |Fee OW |DRL [C
Melesco 4-20C6 - 20 [030S |060W 4301351241 [99999 |Fee OW |DRL _C |
Peck 3-13B5 113 [020S |050W |4301351364 (99999 [Fee OW DRL [C |
Jensen 2-9C4 09 [030S [040W |4301351375 (99999 [Fee OW [DRL C |
El Paso 3-5C4 105 0305 [040W 4301351376 | 18563 |Fee OW DRL [C |
ULT 6-31 31 |030S |020E 4304740033 FEE oW LA ]
OBERHANSLY 2-2A1 02 |010S |010W 4304740164 FEE OW LA
DWR 3-15C6 15 |030S |060W 4301351433 [14-20-H62-4724 OW _ [NEW |C
Lake Fork Ranch 5-2384 23 [020S [040W 4301350739 Fee OW [NEW ]
Duchesne Land 4-10C5 10 |030S |050W [4301351262 Fee OW [NEW C
Cabinland 4-9B3 09 |020S [030W 4301351374 _ |Fee oW INEW [C
Layton 4-2B3 - 02 |020S |030W 4301351389 Fee OW |NEW [C |
Golinski 4-24B5 ]24 |020S [050W [4301351404| Fee = [OW [NEW [C
Alba 1-21C4 21 |030S [040W 4301351460 Fee OW |NEW [C
Allison 4-19C5 19 |030S [050W 4301351466 Fee OW |NEW [C
Seeley 4-3B3 03 [020S [030W 4301351486 Fee OW |NEW C |
Allen 4-25B5 25 |020S |050W 4301351487 Fee OW NEW [C |
Hewett2-6C4 |06 |030S [040W 4301351489 Fee OW INEW [C |
Young 2-7C4 - 07 |030S [040W 4301351500 __ |Fee oW T INEW € ]
Brighton 3-31A1E 31 [010S |010E (4304752471 Fee oW INEw [C ]
Hamaker 3-25A1 |25 |010S [010W 4304752491 __ |Fee OW [NEW [C |
Boiton 3-29A1E B 29 [010S [010E |4304752871 Fee OW [NEW C
HORROCKS 5-20A1 ~ 120 |010S [010W [4301334280 |17378 FEE OW _OPS [C |
DWR 3-19C6 } 19 [030S [060W [4301334263 17440 |14-20-462-1120 OW [P
DWR 3-22C6 f‘* 22 |030S [060W |4301334106 |17298 |14-20-462-1131 [OW P ]
DWR 3-28C6 - 28 030S |060W 4301334264 | 17360 | 14-20-462-1323 OW P
UTE 1-7A2 - - 07 |010S [020W 4301330025 5850 |14-20462-811 OW P ]
UTE 2-17C6 17 |030S [060W [4301331033 10115 |14-20-H62-1118 OW P
WLR TRIBAL 2-19C6 119 0305 |060W [4301331035 | 10250 |14-20-H62-1120 OW [P B
CEDARRIM 10-A-15C6 115 [030S |060W 4301330615 6420 |14-20-H62-1128[OW P | |
CEDAR RIM 12A ] 28 |030S |060W |4301331173 10672 [14-20-H62-1323 OW [P ]
UTE-FEE 2-33C6 B 33 [030S |060W [4301331123 |10365 | 14-20-H62-1328 OW  |P
TAYLOR3-34C6 ~ 134 030S [060W [4301350200 17572 1420H621329 |[OW [P -
BAKER UTE 2-34C6 134 |030S |060W 14301332634 | 14590 |14-20-H62-1329 |OW P T
UTE3-3522K 35 |010N |020W 4301331133 | 10483 |14-20-H62-1614 [OW P | |
UTE 1-3222 |32 |010N[020W 4301330379 1915 |14-20-H62-1702'OW P o
UTE TRIBAL 1-3322 B 133 010N 020W 4301330334 |1851 |14-20-H62-1703 OW [P ]
UTE 2-3322 - 133 010N |020W 4301331111 10451 |14-20-H62-1703/OW P |
UTE TRIBAL 2-3422 |34 [010N[020W (4301331167 10668 |14-20-H62-1704 OW [P j
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-13B4 13 [020S |040W |4301334262 17439 |14-20-H62-1743 OW [P ]
UTE 1-28B4 T 1287]020S|040W 4301330242 1796 |14-20-H62-1745OW P | |
UTE 1-34A4 3 /34 1010S [040W 4301330076 |1585 |14-20-H62-1774 OW [P i
UTE 1-36A4 ] |36 [010S [040W 4301330069 1580 |14-20-H62-1793[OW [P
UTE 1-1B4 - 101 |020S [040W |4301330129 |1700 |14-20-H62-1798 [OW [P ]
UTE 1-31A2 '31_1010S [020W [4301330401 1925 [14-20-H62-1801 OW P
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El Paso E2 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E2 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE 1-25A3 25 |010S [030W 4301330370 1920 |14-20-H62-1802 | OW [P

UTE 2-25A3 - |25 0105 |030W 4301331343 [11361 |14-20-H62-1802[OW [P
UTE1-26A3 ] 126 "|010S [030W [4301330348 |1890 |14-20-H62-1803[OW [P

UTE 2-26A3 26 |010S [030W (4301331340 |11349 [14-20-H62-1803 OW P ]
UTE TRIBAL 4-35A3 135 [010S |030W 4301350274 [18000 [1420H621804 OW P C |
[UTE 2-35A3 T |35 |010S|030W 4301331292 11222 |14-20-H62-1804 [OW [P |
UTE 3-35A3 _ 35 |010S [030W [4301331365 |11454 [1420-H62-1804 OW P |
UTE 1-6B2 o ~ 106 |020S [020W 4301330349 1895 |14-20-H62-1807 [OW [P

UTE 2-6B2 ~ 706 |020S [020W 4301331140 [11190 | 14-20-H62-1807 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-6B2 ) 06 |020S[020W |4301350273 | 18008 |14-20-H62-1807 OW P c
POWELL 4-19A1 - 19 |010S [010W 4301330071 8302 |14-20-H62-1847 [OW [P

COLTHARP 12721 i 27 010N |010W [4301330151 |4700 |14-20-H62-1933 |[OW P~ | |
UTE 1-8A1E T 08 |010S |010E 14304730173 [1846 |14-20-H62-2147 OW P T
UTE TRIBE 1-31 31 |010N |020W (4301330278 |4756 |14-20-H62-2421|[OW P T
UTE 1-28B6X i 28 |020S |060W |4301330510 |11165 |14-20-H62-2492 [OW P ]
RINKER 2-21B5 21 |020S |050W [4301334166 |17299 |14-20-H62-2508 OW [P | |
MURDOCK 2-34B5 |34 [020S [050W [4301331132 |10456 |14-20-H62-2511/OW P |
UTE 1-35B6 35 |020S [060W 4301330507 2335 |14-20-H622531 [OW P | |
'UTE TRIBAL 1-17A1E 17 |010S [010E |4304730829 (860 |14-20-H622658 OW P |
UTE 2-17A1E B 17 1010S [010E |4304737831 16709 |14-20-H622658 [OW [P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-27AE 27 [010S |010E 4304730421800 |14-20-H62-2662 |OW P i
UTE TRIBAL 1-35A1E " I35 [010S|010E [4304730286 (795 |14-20-H62-2665OW P _
UTE TRIBAL 1-15A1E |15 |010S [010E [4304730820 850 |14-20-H622717 OW _ |P )
UTE TRIBALP-3B1E |03 |020S |010E |4304730190 4536 |14-20-H622873[OW P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-22A1E ) |22 ]010S [010E 4304730429810 |14-20-H62-3103/oW P |
B H UTE 1-35C6 I35 |030S|060W [4301330419 10705 [14-20-H62-3436 OW |P |
BH UTE 2-35C6 7|35 [030S [060W |4301332790 | 15802 | 14-20-H62-3436 [OW P |
MCFARLANE 14D6 ] " |04 |040S [060W [4301331074 10325 14-20-H62-3452[OW [P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-11D6 i 11 /040S [060W 4301330482 (6415 |14-20-H62-3454 OW P |
CARSON 2-36A1 36 |010S |010W 4304731407 737 |14-20-H62-3806 OW P )
UTE 2-14C6 7714 [030S [060W 4301330775 |9133 |14-20-H62-3809 [OW [P B
DWR 3-14C6 114 [030S |060W |4301334003 [17092 |14-20-H62-3808 OW P |
THE PERFECT "10" 1-10A1 10 [010S |010W 4301330935 [9461 |14-20-H62-3855 OW P ]
BADGER-SAM H UMONGUS 1-15A1 (15 _|010S |010W 4301330949 [9462 |14-20-H62-3860 OW P | |
MAXIMILLIAN-UTE 14-1 14 [010S [030W 4301330726 |8437 |14-20-H62-3868 [OW P |
FRED BASSETT 1-22A1 122 p10S [010W 4301330781 [0460 [14-20-H62-3880 .OW P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-30Z1 30 |010N |010W [4301330813[9405 |14-20-H62-3910 OW P =
UTELB1-13A3 13 |010S [030W [4301330894 9402 |14-20-H62-3980([OW P 1
UTE 2-22B6 B |22 [020S '060W 4301331444 11641 [14-20-H62-4614 OW P ]
UINTAOURAY 1-1A3 o1 [010S 030W 4301330132 5540 |14-20-H62-4664 OW P |
UTE 1-6D6 ] 06 |040S |060W [4301331696 |12058 |14-20-H62-4752 |OW  |P

UTE 2-11D6 111 |040S |060W (4301350179 |17667 |1420H624801 |OW P T
UTE 1-15D6 ) o 15 [040S |060W 4301330429 | 10958 [14-20-H62-4824 OW P | |
UTE 2-15D6 15 |040S [060W 4301334026 (17193 |14-20-H624824 OW P o
HILL 3-24C6 " |24 |030S |060W 4301350293 [18020 | 1420H624866 | OW  |P C
BARCLAY UTE 2-24C6R "~ 724 |030S |060W |4301333730 | 16385 [14-20-H62-4866 [ OW P o
BROTHERSON 1-2B4 "oz ]020S |040W |4301330062 |1570 |FEE ow P T ]
BOREN 1-24A2 |24 010S|020W [4301330084 |5740 |[FEE ow p I
FARNSWORTH1-1385 13 1020S [050W 4301330092 [1610 |FEE ow P I ]
BROADHEAD 1-21B6 121 |020S |060W 4301330100 1595 |FEE ow P ]
ASAY E J 1-20A1 20 [010S |010W 4301330102 [8304 |FEE ow P
HANSON TRUST 1-6B3 05 |020S [030W [4301330109 (16356 |[FEE ow P |
ELLSWORTH 1-8B4 B 08 |020S [040W 4301330112 16556 |FEE ow P |~
ELLSWORTH1-9B4 ~ ""109 [020S |040W 4301330118 1660 |FEE ow P
ELLSWORTH 1-17B4 ) 17 |[020S [040W [4301330126 1695 |FEE ow P | ]
CHANDLER 1-5B4 ~ o5 [020S [040W [4301330140 |1685 FEE ow P
[HANSON 1-32A3 32 [010S[030W 4301330141 |1640 |FEE oW P i
JESSEN 1-17A4 117 [070S [040W (4301330173 |4725 |FEE ow P

2



El Paso E3 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E3 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

JENKINS 1-1B3

01 [020S [030W [4301330175[1790 |FEE ow P
GOODRICH1-2B3 |02 |020S |030W |4301330182 |1765 FEE ow [P ]
ELLSWORTH 1-19B4 19 |020S [040W 4301330183 |1760 |[FEE ow [P )
DOYLE 1-10B3 10 [020S |030W [4301330187 (1810 [FEE |OW P B
JOS.SMITH1-17C5 |17 _|030S [050W |4301330188 |5510 |[FEE ow p |
RUDY 1-11B3 o 11 [020S [030W 4301330204 |1820 |FEE oW P
CROOK 1-6B4 - 06 |020S |040W (4301330213 1825 |FEE ow P B
HUNT 1-21B4 ) 121 |020S |040W (4301330214 [1840 |FEE ow P
LAWRENCE 1-30B4 30 [020S |040W 4301330220 (1845 |[FEE ow [P B
YOUNG 1-29B4 |29 ]020S |040W 4301330246 1791 FEE =~ OW P
GRIFFITHS 1-33B4 133 1020S |040W [4301330288(4760 [FEE ~ OW P ﬂ
POTTER 1-2B5 02 [020S |050W [4301330293 (1826 |FEE oW P B
BROTHERSON 1-26B4 |26 [020S [040W [4301330336/1856 [FEE oW P | |
SADIE BLANK 1-33Z1 33 |010N |010W 4301330355(765 [FEE ~ OW P ]
[POTTER 1-24B5 24 |020S |050W 4301330356 |1730 |FEE oW P
WHITEHEAD 1-22A3 o 22 |010S |030W |4301330357 1885 FEE ow [P
CHASEL MILLER 2-1A2 101 ]010S |020W [4301330360/5830 FEE =~ OW P B
ELDER 1-13B2 113 |020S |020W 4301330366 (1905 FEE ~~ OW P B
BROTHERSON 2-10B4 |10 |020S [040W [4301330443 |1615 |[FEE ow |p B
FARNSWORTH 2-7B4 07 |020S |040W [4301330470(1935 [FEE oW P B
TEW 1-15A3 - 15 _|010S |030W 4301330529/1945 FEE __~ OW [P )
UTE FEE 2-20C5 - 20 [030S |050W [4301330550 4527 |[FEE low |
HOUSTON 1-34Z1 - 34 010N |010W [4301330566 (885 |FEE ow P
GALLOWAY 1-18B1 ) ~ 118 |020S |010W 4301330575 [2365 FEE ow P [ ]
SMITH 1-31B5 ] 31 1020S |050W [4301330577 [1955 |FEE oW P
LEBEAU 1-34A1 ] 134 1010S |010W [4301330590(1440 FEE =~ OW P |
LINMAR 1-19B2 ) 19 |020S |020W 14301330600 (9350 |FEE ow P ]
WISSE 1-28Z1 B |28 |010N [010W (4301330609 (905 |FEE ow p |
POWELL 1-21B1 ] 21 |020S [010W 4301330621 (910 |FEE ow |p |
HANSEN 1-24B3 24 020S |030W 4301330629 2390 [FEE ow P
OMAN 2-4B4 ] 04 [020S [040W |4301330645/9125 [FEE ~ |OW P )
DYE 1-2522 |25 010N |020W [4301330659/9111 [FEE ~~  OW P
H MARTIN 1-21Z1 21 |010N [010W 4301330707 |925 |FEE ow P
JENSEN 1-29Z1 i 29 |010N|010W [4301330725/9110 [FEE ~ |OW [P
CHASEL 2-17A1V |17 |o10S |010W 4301330732/9112 FEE OW P |
BIRCHELL 1-27A1 B 27 |010S |010W |4301330758/940 [FEE =~ |ow P |
CHRISTENSEN 2-8B3 08 [020S |030W [4301330780 |9355 |FEE ow p |
LAMICQ 2-5B2 05 [020S [020W [4301330784 [2302 |FEE ow P ]
BROTHERSON 2-14B4 14 |020S |[040W '4301330815 10450 FEE =~ Oow P = |
MURRAY 3-2A2 |02 Jo10S 020w [4301330816/9620 [FEE =~~~ Oow [P ' |
HORROCKS 2-20A1 V 20 |010S |010W 4301330833 |8301 |FEE ow P N
BROTHERSON 2-2B4 ] 02 020S [040W [4301330855 8420 |FEE ow P |
ELLSWORTH 2-8B4 |08 |020S [040W |4301330898 [2418 |FEE ow p | ]
OMAN 2-32A4 - 132 _|010S |040W [4301330904 (10045 |[FEE ow [, |
BELCHER 2-33B4 33 |020S |040W 4301330907 (9865 [FEE =~ OW P
BROTHERSON2-35B5 35 |020S 050W |4301330908/9404 FEE =~ oW P =
HORROCKS 24A1 T - |04 |010S |010W |4301330954 9855 [FEE ow P
JENSEN229A5 29 '010S [050W 4301330974 [10040FEE OW P ]
UTE 2-34A4 |34 |010S [040W [4301330978 [10070/FEE  |OW P )
CHANDLER 2-5B4 |05 _|020S [040W (4301331000 [10075]FEE ~ |OW P ]
BABCOCK 2-12B4 |12 020S [040W |4301331005/10215[FEE ~OW P
BADGER MR BOOM BOOM 2-29A1 |29 |010S [010W [4301331013/9463 FEE =~ |OW P |
BLEAZARD 2-18B4 |18 [020S ;040W 4301331025 |1566 |FEE __ow P
BROADHEAD 2-32B5 |32 1020S |050W 4301331036 |10216 |FEE ow p |
ELLSWORTH 2-1684 16 020S |040W 4301331046 (10217 [FEE  |OW [P |
RUST 3-4B3 ... |04 |020S 030W 4301331070 1576 |[FEE = |OW P _
HANSON TRUST 2-32A3 32 |010S |030W 4301331072 1641 |FEE ow P
BROTHERSON 2-11B4 '11_1020S [040W 4301331078 [1541 [FEE ow__ P
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El Paso E4 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E4 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HANSON TRUST 2-6B3 05 [020S [030W [4301331079]1636 [FEE _|OW P
BROTHERSON 2-15B4 15 |020S 040W (4301331103 /1771 [FEE ~ ow P |
MONSEN 2-27A3 27 010S1030W (4301331104 1746 |FEE ow [P
ELLSWORTH2-19B4 19 1020S [040W |4301331105|1761 FEE _OW P |
[HUNT2:21B4 " "121 [020S |040W (4301331114 [1839 |FEE _ow P )
JENKINS2-1B3 01 |020S |030W 4301331117 [1792 [FEE low P |
POTTER2-24B5 - 24 |020S [050W 4301331118/1731 FEE  Jow P T N
POWELL2-13A2K - 13 |010S |020W |4301331120 |8306 |FEE ow P I
JENKINS 2-12B3 12 |020S |030W [4301331121 10459 [FEE ow |
MURDOCK 2-26B5 |26 |020S |050W [43013311241531 (FEE oW P | |
BIRCH3-2785 127 |020S |050W (4301331126 [1783 FEE Cjow P
ROBB 2-29B5 - ~ 129 1020S [050W |4301331130 |10454 [FEE ow P 1
LAKEFORK2-13B4 13 [020S|040W 4301331134 [10452 [FEE T jow [P |
DUNCAN 3-1A2 K T 01 |010S |020W [4301331135 10484 |FEE ow P ]
[HANSON 2-9B3 T 09 |020S [030W [4301331136 |10455 [FEE ow p |
ELLSWORTH 2-9B4 |09 10208 [040W 4301331138 10460/ FEE OW P | |
UTE 2-31A2 o 31 |010S |020W |4301331139 | 10458 |FEE OW"WE“" o
POWELL 2-19A1 K 19 |010S |010W (4301331149 8303 |FEE low P T
CEDAR RIM 8-A - 22 7]030S |060W |4301331171|10666 [FEE Tow P ]
POTTER 2-6B4 - 06 |020S [040W [4301331249 11038 [FEE ow P | |
MILES 2-1B5 ~ o1 |020S |050W |4301331257 (11062 |FEE ~ low P ]
MILES 2-3B3 - 03 [020S |030W 4301331261 |11102)FEE OW [P

MONSEN 2-22A3 122 |010S |030W 4301331265 | 11098 |FEE _ ow P

WRIGHT 21385 ~ ]13 |020S |050W 4301331267 (11115 FEE  [OW [P | |
TODD2-21A3 21 |010S [030W [4301331296 | 11268 |FEE Clow P [
WEIKART 22084 |29 020S040W[4301331298[11332|FEE  |OW P ]
YOUNG 2-15A3 |15 |010S [030W |4301331301 |11344 [FEE low P B
CHRISTENSEN 2-29A4 B |29 1010S1040W 4301331303 [11235[FEE [oW P | B
BLEAZARD 2-28B4 - 28 |020S |040W [4301331304 |11433 [FEE ow P ]
REARY 2-17A3 ~ |17 |010S[030W 4301331318 [11251 |FEE ow P ]
LAZY K 2-11B3 |11 _|020S[030W |4301331352 11362 FEE oW P | |
[AZYK2-14B3 14 |020S030W 4301331354 [11452/FEE  |[OW IE‘: L
MATTHEWS 2-13B2 13 |020S |020W [4301331357 | 11374 |FEE Tow P T
LAKE FORK 3-15B4 |15 |020S |040W [4301331358 | 11378 [FEE ______|[OW P N
STEVENSON 3-20A3 T 129 |010S030W 4301331376 11442 FEE ___OW P I
MEEKS3-883 B ”498 020S 030W |4301331377 11489 FEE | ow P |
ELLSWORTH 3-20B4 120 1020S[040W 4301331389 (11488 FEE  |low P | ]
DUNCAN 5-13A2 - 13 |010S |020W 4301331516 |11776 [FEE ow P ]
OWL 3-17C5 17 _[030S |050W 4301332112 [12476 FEE ow P
BROTHERSON 2-24B4 ] 124 ]020S '040W |4301332695[14652|[FEE ~ |OW P :
BODRERO 2-15B3 |15 |020S |030W |4301332755|14750 FEE =~ oW P |
BROTHERSON 2-25B4 |25 ]020S |040W [4301332791 [15044 [FEE ow p T
CABINLAND 2-16B3 16 |020S [030W 4301332914 15236 [FEE = |OW [P 7
KATHERINE 3-29B4 ~ 129 [020S [040W 4301332923 [15331 [FEE ow |p |
SHRINERS 2-10C5 ~ /10 |030S |050W [4301333008 [15908 |FEE ~low P ﬂ ]
BROTHERSON 2-26B4 126 |020S [040W [4301333139/17047 FEE oW [P T ]
MORTENSEN 4-32A2 '32 |010S |020W |4301333211 15720 |FEE Clow
FERRARINI3-27B4 127 [020S 040W 4301333265 15883/FEE =~ |OW P | -
RHOADES 2-25B5 - 25 1020S |050W [4301333467 16046 [FEE ow P j
CASE 2-3184 - /31 |020S |040W 4301333548 | 16225 |FEE T low P
ANDERSON-ROWLEY 2-24B3 Wi#zj 020S [030W 4301333616 (16284 FEE ow P | _
SPROUSE BOWDEN 2-18B1 |18 |020S |010W [4301333808 [16677 [FEE ow P L]
BROTHERSON 3-11B4 |11 jo20S |040W 4301333904 [16891]FEE = OW P |
KOFFORD 2-36B5 ) 136 |020S |050W |4301333988(17048 FEE = OW [P |
ALLEN3-7B4 ~lo7 |020S |040W |4301334027 |17166 |FEE low P
[BOURNAKIS 3-18B4 ~ 18 |020S [040W |4301334091 17264 [FEE = |OW P

MILES 3-12B5 112 ]020S|050W [4301334110[17316 FEE __ OW [P

OWL and HAWK 2-31B5 ' T31 020S [050W [4301334123 17388 |FEE low P
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El Paso E5 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E5 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

OWL and HAWK 4-17C5 17 0305 |050W [4301334193 | 17387 |FEE ow P | ]
DWR 3-32B5 132 l020S |050W 4301334207 |17371 |FEE Tow P’
LAKE FORK RANCH 32284 22 |020S |040W |4301334261 17409 [FEE  |OW P |
HANSON 3-9B3 ) 109 [020S [030W |4301350065 |17570 |FEE ow [P ]
DYE 2-28A1 28 |010S [010W 4301350066 |17531 |FEE ow P |
MEEKS 3-32A4 " {32 [010S |040W |4301350069 17606 FEE Jow b
[HANSON 4-8B3 |08 |020S |030W 4301350088 17571 FEE =~ OW P  C
LAKE FORKRANCH3-14B4 |14 |020S |040W 4301350007 17484 [FEE ow p
ALLEN 3-9B4 |09 |020S |040W 4301350123 |17656 FEE ow P |
HORROCKS 4-20A1 20 |010S |010W 4301350155 |17916 | FEE ow P | ]
HURLEY 2-33A1 133 _|010S 010W |4301350166 17573 [FEE ow P
HUTCHINS/CHIODO 3-20C5 20 |030S [050W (4301350190 17541 |FEE ow P ]
ALLEN 3-8B4 08 |020S |040W 4301350192 17622 |[FEE_|ow [P |
OWL and HAWK 3-10C5 B (10 |030S |050W 4301350193 |17532 | FEE ow P ’
OWL and HAWK 3-19C5 - 19 |030S [050W (4301350201 |17508 [FEE ow P T
EL PASO 420B5 " " 129 |020S [050W 4301350208 |17934 |FEE ow P C_|
DONIHUE 3-20C6 20 |030S |060W 4301350270 |17762 [FEE ow P )
HANSON 3-5B3 " los 1020S [030W 4301350275 17725 [FEE ow P ¢
SPRATT 3-26B5 26 |020S |050W 4301350302 [17668 |FEE T low P ]
REBEL 3-35B5 ] ~ I35 |020S (050W 4301350388 [17911 |FEE ow P Cc
FREEMAN 4-16B4 T 16 |020S |040W 4301350438 |17935 |Fee low Pl ]
WILSON 3-36B5 T 77 7 6 |020S |050W [4301350439 (17936 Fee 2 oW P 'C
EL PASO 321B4 21 10205 |040W |4301350474 [18123 |Fee Jow P c |
IORG 4-12B3 7712 [020S [030W [4301350487 |17981 [Fee ow P [
CONOVER 3-383 o 03 |020S |030W 4301350526 [18122[Fee __1OW [P Ic |
ROWLEY 3-16B4 B 16 [020S |040W |4301350569 | 18151 [Fee ow P ¢
POTTS 3-14B3 ) 14 0205 |030W 4301350570 18366 [Fee ow P ¢
POTTER 4-27B5 27 020S |050W 4301350571 |99999 |Fee ow P c ]
EL PASO 4-21B4 21 |020S |040W 4301350572 | 18152 |Fee “low P c
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-26B4 26 |020S |040W 4301350707 | 18270 |Fee ow P ¢ |
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-25B4 T |25 020S|040W [4301350711 | 18220 |Fee T Tlow P ¢
LAKE FORK RANCH 42384 23 (0205 |040W 4301350713 |18271 |Fee —ow h{d ic
LAKE FORK RANCH4-1584 1150208 |040W |4301350715 | 18314 Fee Jow E Cle ]
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-24B4 124 |020S [040W 4301350716 |18269 Fee CJow TP e
GOLINSKI 1-8C4 T |08 |030S |040W 4301350986 18301 [Fee 2 ___OW P C |
J ROBERTSON 1-1B1 ] /01 |020S |010W 4304730174 |5370 |FEE ow P o
TIMOTHY 1-8B1E 08 [020S [010E |4304730215 1910 FEE oW P j
MAGDALENE PAPADOPULOS 1-34A1E (34 [010S |010E [4304730241 785 |FEE jow P T
NELSON 131A1E © 731 0105 [010E |4304730671 830 FEE ow [p 1]
[ROSEMARY LLOYD 1-24A1E |24 |010S 010E 14304730707 840 |FEE TTow P ,,,
H D LANDY 1-30A1E o 30 |010S |[010E |4304730790 845 |FEE oW P 1
WALKER 1-14A1E 14 |010S |010E 4304730805(855 |FEE oW [P | |
BOLTON2-29A1E |29 |010S[010E [4304731112[900 |FEE ow [P
PRESCOTT1-3521  [35 [010N|010W 4304731173 (1425 [FEE oW P | |
BISELGURR 11-1 11 0105 |010W 4304731213 |8438 |FEE Tow P ]
UTETRIBAL2-22A1E =~ 122 ,010S 010E 4304731265915 |[FEE ~~ OW P N
L. BOLTON 1-12A1 7 T2 ]010S [010W 14304731295 (920 |FEE ow p

FOWLES 1-26A1 |26 1010S |010W |4304731296 |930 |FEE ow P
BRADLEY23-1 - 23 |010S |010W |4304731297 (8435 FEE = IOW P
BASTIAN1-2A1 02 [010S [010W 4304731373 |736 |FEE low [P T
DRLONG2-19AME 19 i010S |010E |4304731470 9505 FEE ow
DMOON 1-23Z1 |23 010N |010W 4304731479 |[10310[FEE ~~|OW P
O MOON 2-26Z1 |26 |010N |010W 14304731480 10135 FEE - ow P |
LLAD225A1  "]25 |010S|010W 4304731797 10790|/FEE _ OW P L
LANDY 2-30A1E 30 |010S |010E 4304731895 11127/FEE oW P
WINN P2-381E 103 [020S |010E 4304732321 | 11428 |FEE Clow P
BISEL.GURR2-11A1 711 [010S 010W 4304735410 |14428/FEE OW P
FLYING J FEE 2-12A1 12 10105 [010W 14304739467 | 16686 | FEE oW P
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El Paso E6 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy £E6 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HARVEST FELLOWSHIP CHURCH 2-14B1_[14 1020S [010W (4304739591 [16546[FEE  OW [P j
OBERHANSLY3-11A1 111 ]010S |010W (4304739679 17937 |[FEE | ow P I
DUNCAN2-34A1 134 1010S 010W |4304739944 17043 |FEE - ow P

BISEL GURR 4-11A1 11 |010S |010W (4304739961 16791/FEE low P |
KILLIAN 3-12A1 112 |010S |010W |4304740226 17761 /ML39760 @ [OW P I
WAINOCO ST 1-14B1 ~ 7144 1020 [010W 4304730818 (1420 |ML24306-A [OW P |
UTAHSTUTE1-35A1 135 ,010S 010W 4304730182 5520 |ML-25432 = OW P | |
STATE 1-19A4 |19 |010S |040W 4301330322 9118 ML-27912  |OW P | |
FEDERAL2-28E19E 128 |050S |190E 4304732849 12117 UTU-0143512 |OW P | |
[FEDERAL 1-28E19E - 28 |050S [190E |4304730175 5680 |UTU143512 |OW [P
BLANCHARD 1-3A2 103 [010S |020W 4301320316 |5877 |FEE ow PA |
WH BLANCHARD2-3A2 |03 |010S |020W 4301330008 5775 |FEE ow PA
YACK U 1-7A1 - 07 |010S|010W |4301330018(5795 FEE ~ OW [PA '
JAMESPOWELL3 113 010S |020W 4301330024 {8305 |FEE WD PA ]
BASTIAN1(3-7D) 07 |010S |010W |4301330026 5800 [FEE =~ OW |PA
LAMICQ-URRUTY18A2 08 |010S |020W 4301330036 5975 [FEE _  [OW  [PA
BLEAZARD1-18B4 118 020S |040W [4301330059 |11262 FEE ow |PA

OLSEN 1-27A4 |27 |010S |040W /4301330064 1565 FEE =~ OW |PA | |
EVANS 1-31A4 - 31 010S 040W 4301330067 |6330 |FEE ow IPA | ]
HAMBLIN 1-26A2 26 |010S [020W [4301330083 2305 |FEE ow PA | |
HARTMAN1-31A3 131 |010S |030W 4301330093 |10700 |FEE ow PA
FARNSWORTH1-7B4 07 |020S |040W [4301330097 5725 |FEE ow @7 e W
POWELL 1-33A3 33 |010S |030W |4301330105/4526 FEE  IOW PA |
LOTRIDGE GATES1-383 03 |020S 030W 4301330117 1625 [FEE _  |OW PA | |
REMINGTON 1-34A3 134 |010S |030W 14301330139 |1670 |FEE . ow [PA |
ANDERSON1-28A2 28 1010S 020W 4301330150,5895 |FEE . |OW |PA | = |
RHOADES MOON 1-35B5 35 [020S [050W 14301330155 |5270 |FEE ow PA ]
JOHN 1-382 o 03 |020S |020W |4301330160(5765 FEE ~  |OW |PA |
SMITH 1-6C5 o6 [030S 050w [4301330163 |5385 |FEE _jow PA |
HORROCKS FEE 1-3A1 |03 [010S[010W[4301330171|5505 FEE ___ OW PA | |
WARREN1-32A4 32 1010S |040W 4301330174 9139 FEE  ~ |OW  PA
JENSENFENZEL 1-20C5 |20 [030S |050W 4301330177 4730 [FEE ~  [OW  |PA e
MYRINRANCH1-13B4 13 |020S |040W 4301330180 |[4524 |FEE _ow PA |
BROTHERSON 12784 7sz 020S |040W [4301330185 1775 |FEE ow PA | |
JENSEN 1-31A5 131 1010S [050W [4301330186 |4735 |FEE ow PA |
ROBERTSON1-28A2 129 010S [020W |4301330189 [4740 |[FEE @ﬂ,, PA ]
WINKLER1-2843 128 {010S |030W [4301330191 |5465 |FEE oW |PA | ,
CHENEY1-33A2 "33 |010S|020W 4301330202[1750 [FEE __ [OW _ [PA |
JLAMICQ STATE1-6B1 |06 [020S [010W |4301330210|5730 |FEE oW PA
REESEESTATE1-10B2 110 [020S |020W 4301330215 5700 |[FEE ow  [PA 1
REEDER 1-178B5 - 17 |020S |050W (4301330218 5460 |FEE - low PA ]
ROBERTSONUTE1-2B2 02 |020S [020W |4301330225/1710 FEE = 1OW IPA L; ]
HATCH 1-5B1 .~ |05 ]020S 010W 4301330226 5470 FEE =~ |OW |PA
BROTHERSON 1-22B4 - fﬂ 020S |040W 4301330227 (5935 FEE ~ low |PA I
ALLRED 1-16A3 - 16 |010S |030W [4301330232 |1780 |FEE oW  PA 1
BIRCH 1-35A5 35 |010S [050W 4301330233 9116 FEE | OW [PA [
MARQUERITEUTE1-882 /08 |020S [020W [4301330235(9122 FEE = |OW  |PA |
BUZZI1-11B2 11 [020S|020W 4301330248(6335 [FEE |OW |PA | |
SHISLER 1-3B1 77,77@ 1020 [010W 14301330249 (5960 FEE OW PA 1 B
TEW 1-1B5 o1 Jo20S 050w 4301330264 (5580 FEE |OW |PA | |
EVANSUTE1-19B3 |19 |020S |030W 4301330265 (1870 [FEE _‘PQV!_ PA
SHELL2-27A4 " " '27 1010S|040W 4301330266 1776 [FEE WD [PA [
DYE 1-29A1 ) B |29 |010S |010W |4301330271 /99990 FEE o ow PA
VODA UTE 1-4C5 S ‘¥04 030S |050W 14301330283 4530 FEE ow |pPA |
BROTHERSON 1-28A4 Tz_é 010S |040W [4301330292 9114 FEE |OW |PA | |
MEAGHER14B2 104 |020S |020W 4301330313 8402 FEE =~ |OW JPA
NORLING19B1 109 |020S 010W 4301330315 1811 |[FEE ) }9\{\( [PA

S. BROADHEAD 1-9C5 '09 '030S |050W 14301330316 |5940 |FEE OW PA



E! Paso E7 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E7 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

TIMOTHY 1-00A3 09 010S [030W 4301330321 10883 |FEE ow__ [PA__ |
BARRETT 1-34A5 34 |010S |050W 4301330323 9115 |FEE OW PA )
MEAGHER TRIBAL 1-9B2 09 |020S |020W 4301330325 9121 |[FEE _|OW PA |
PHILLIPS UTE 1-3C5 03 |030S [050W (4301330333 1816 |FEE Jow |pA ]
[ELLSWORTH 1-2084 T |20 020S |040W |4301330351(6376 |[FEE _ |OW _ PA
LAWSON128A1 28" [010S [010W [4301330358 (5015 [FEE  |OW |PA B
AMES 1-23A4 723 |010S [040W (4301330375 1901 |FEE ow pa T
HORROCKS 1-6A1 06 |010S [010W 4301330390 5675 |FEE oW [PA |
SHRINE HOSPITAL 1-10C5 10 [030S [050W |4301330393 [5565 [FEE oW |PA |
GOODRICH 1-18B2 18~ |020S |020W 4301330397 |5485 |FEE “jow PA i
SWD POWELL 3 7713 |010S|020W 4301330478 [10708/FEE WD _PA | |
BODRERO 1-1583 115 |020S |030W 4301330565 [4534 |FEE OW |PA B
MOON TRIBAL 1-30C4 ~ 7 /30 |[030S |040W 4301330576 |2360 |FEE OW |PA 7
DUNCAN2:9B5 109 |020S|050W 4301330719 |5440 |FEE Tlow T PA T
FISHER 1-16A4 ~ 116 |010S [040W 4301330737 2410 [FEE ____OW PA |
URRUTY 2-34A2 34 |010S [020W [4301330753 9117 |FEE ow [PA | ]
GOODRICH 1-24A4 ) 24 |010S [040W [4301330760 2415 |FEE ow PA
CARL SMITH 2-25A4 25 |010S|040W 4301330776 9136 |FEE “low  PA |
ANDERSON 1-A30B1 ~ |30 020S [010W |4301330783 [9137 |FEE low A T
CADILLAC 3-6A1 06 |010S 010W 4301330834 6316 [FEE __ |OW  |PA )
MCELPRANG 2-31A1 131 |010S [010W (4301330836 [8439 |FEE ow [PA | ]
[REESE ESTATE 2-1082 10 |020S [020W 4301330837 [2417 FEE oW PA | ]
CLARK 2-9A3 T 09 [010S |030W 4301330876 [2416 |FEE ow [PA ]
JENKINS 3-16A3 16 |010S |030W 4301330877 |9790 |FEE ow PA |
CHRISTENSEN 2-26A5 26 |010S [050W (4301330905 10710 FEE ____|OW  PA |
FORD 2-36A5 T 7 36 |010S |050W [4301330911]9630 |[FEE ow [PA |
MORTENSEN2-32A2 /32 0105 [020W |4301330029 (9486 |FEE oW PA -
WILKERSON 1-20Z1 120 [010N|010W [4301330042 5452 [FEE __ |OW _PA |
UTE TRIBAL24A3S 04 [010S [030W (4301330950 |10230 [FEE ow A |
OBERHANSLY 2-31Z1 31 |010N |010W 4301330970 9262 [FEE oW PA_ |
MORRIS2-7A3 07 [010S [030W (4301330977 9725 [FEE  |OW PA |
POWELL2-08A3 o8 [010S|030W 4301330979 10175 FEE  |OW |PA |
[FISHER 2-6A3 7 oe 0105 [030W [4301330984 [10110 [FEE ow A ||
JACOBSEN2-12A4 " ""42 [010S 040W 4301330985 10480 [FEE  IOW [PA | |
CHENEY 2-33A2 33 |010S |020W 4301331042 10313 [FEE ow [PA
HANSON TRUST 2-20A3 29 [010S|030W [4301331043/5306 [FEE |OW _ PA |
BURTON 2-15B5 15 |020S |050W |4301331044 [10205 [FEE oW [PA
EVANS-UTE 2-17B3 17 |020S |030W [4301331056 (10210 FEE __ |OW _ IPA ]
ELLSWORTH 2-20B4 20 020S [040W 4301331090(5336 FEE _ |OW  PA -
REMINGTON 2-34A3 7 134 |010S [030W |4301331091 1902 [FEE __[OW PA |
WINKLER 2-28A3 |28 |010S|030W |4301331108 [4519 |FEE ow PA | ]
TEW 2-10B5 10 0205 |050W |4301331125 1751 FEE _ |OW _ |PA )
LINDSAY 2-33A4 _ ,A, 33 |010S [040W [43013311411756 [FEE _OW |PA_ | ]
FIELDSTED 228A4 28 (0105 [040W [4301331293 (10665 FEE  |[OW |PA | |
POWELL 4-13A2_ 13 [010S [020W |4301331336 | 11177 |FEE GW PA |
DUMP 2-20A3 S 20 [010S [030W [4301331505 | 11691 |FEE oW  [PA
[SMITH 2X-23C7 __ 23 |030S |070W |4301331634 12382)FEE D  PA | |
MORTENSEN 3-32A2 32 |010S |020W 14301331872 11928 [FEE ow PA |
TODDUSAST12B1 02 |020S 010W 4304730167 99998 FEE ~~  |OW  [PA

STATE 1-7B1E o7 |020S|010E |4304730180|5566 [FEE _ |ow [PA |
BACON 1-10B1E 10 |020S [010E 14304730881 5550 [FEE  |OW PA | |
PARIETTE DRAW 2844 28 [040S [010E 14304731408 (4537 FEE ow  PA |
REYNOLDS2-7B1E 07 |020S 010E 4304731840 4960 |FEE ow ~PA | |
STATE 2-35A2 ] 135 010S |020W 4301330156 4715 |ML-22874 _ |OW _ @@M N
UTAH STATE L B 1-11B1 |11 [020S |010W 4304730715530 |ML23655  |OW  [PA B
STATE 1-8A3 |08 0105 030W 4301330286 5655 ML-24316  [OW  PA
UTAHFEDERAL 12481 124 |020S [010W 4304730220 590 |ML26079  [OW  PA |
CEDAR RIM 15 '34_|030S [0B0W 14301330383 |6395 [14-20-462-1329 [OW 'S

7



El Paso E8 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E8 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE TRIBAL 2-24C7 — |24 [030S [070W [4301331028 | 10240 |14-20-H62-1135 OW __|S 7
CEDARRIM 12 28 |030S [060W 4301330344 6370 |14-20-H62-1323 [OW  [S
CEDAR RIM 16 " |33 |030S [060W [4301330363 6390 | 14-20-H62-1328 OW  |S

SPRING HOLLOW 2-3473 34 |010N |030W 4301330234 5255 |14-20-H62-1480 OW | )
EVANS UTE 1-17B3 17 |020S |[030W [4301330274 5335 |14-20-H62-1733[OW S | |
UTE JENKS 2-1-B4G_ o1 |020S [040W [4301331197 | 10844 14-20-H62-1782 OW  |S
UTE 3-1283 ) 12 [020S [030W |4301331379 |11490 |14-20-H62-1810 [OW  [S ,
UTETRIBAL94B1 |04 |020S [010W (4301330194 5715 [14-20-H62-1969/OW S | |
UTETRIBAL221B6 |21 [020S [060W 4301331424 11615 |14-20-H62-2489 |OW  |S )
UTE 1-33B6 ) ] "33 |020S [060W [4301330441 1230 |14-20-H62-2493 |OW IS

UTE22285 22 1020S [050W [4301331122 (10453 [14-20-H62-2509 OW S | |
UTE 1-18B1E 118 ]020S |010E |4304730969 [9135 |14-20-H62-2864 OW _ |S ]
LAUREN UTE 123A3 |23 ]010S [030W 4301330895 [9403 |14-20-H62-3981 OW (S _

UTE 2-28B6 T |28 [020S [060W [4301331434 [11624 |14-20-H62-4622 [OW | o
UTE127B6X |27 1020S |060W 4301330517 [11166 |14-20-H62-4631 [OW 'S )
UTE 22786 | 127 [020S |060W 4301331449 11660 |14-20-H62-4631 OW S o
CEDAR RIM 10-15C6 - 15 |030S |060W 4301330328 6365 |14-20-H62-4724 OW  |S |
UTE 5-30A2 ~ |30 |010S 020W 4301330169 [5910 [14-20-H62-4863 [OW  |S B
UTE TRIBAL G-1 (1-24C6) , 24 |030S |060W |4301330298 [4533 |14-20-H624866 OW | | |
UTE TRIBAL FEDERAL 1-30C5 1307 ]030S |050W |4301330475 |665 | 14-20-H62-4876 [OW  |S

SMB 1-10A2 - 10 |010S |020W |4301330012 |5865 |FEE ow s | ]
KENDALL 1-12A2 - 12 |010S[020W [43013300135875 FEE ___ |OW S T
CEDARRIM 2 B 20 |030S |060W [4301330019 6315 |FEE ow | o
URRUTY29A2 ~ 109 [010S [020W |4301330046 [6856 |FEE ow s |
BROTHERSON 1-14B4 14 |020S |040W |4301330051 [1535 |FEE ow s 7
RUST 14B3 ] 04 |020S |030W 4301330063 [1575 [FEE ow [s | ]
MONSEN 1-21A3 21 010S |030W [4301330082 [1590 |FEE oW s 1
BROTHERSON 1-10B4 ) 10 |020S [040W 4301330110 1614 (FEE oW |8 T
FARNSWORTH 1-12B5 12 |020S [050W [4301330124 (1645 |FEE oW [s ]
ELLSWORTH 1-16B4 "~ 116 020S [040W [4301330192[1735 [FEE ____ |[OW S

MARSHALL 1-20A3 20 |010S |030W |4301330193 9340 |FEE ow s )
[CHRISTMAN BLAND 1-31B4 317 [020S [040W |4301330198 [4745 |FEE ~low s
ROPER 1-14B3 ) 114 |020S[030W 4301330217 (1850 |FEE ow [s | ]
BROTHERSON 1-24B4 - 24 |020S |040W |4301330229 |1865 |[FEE oW S i
BROTHERSON 1-33A4 33 [010S[040W [4301330272([1680 [FEE __ |OW |S
BROTHERSON 1-2384 123 |020S |040W 4301330483 (8423 |FEE ow s~ | ]
SMITH ALBERT 2-8C5 08 |030S [050W [4301330543 |5495 |FEE ow s T
VODA JOSEPHINE 2-19C5 19 |030S |050W (4301330553 (5650 |FEE ~jow [s }
HANSEN 1-16B3 16 [020S |030W 4301330617 |9124 |FEE ow s
BROTHERSON 1-25B4 ) 25 |020S [040W 4301330668 9126 |FEE ow "is ]
POWELL2-33A3 - 33 |010S [030W [4301330704 [2400 |FEE ow s | ]
BROWN2-28B5 28 |020S [050W [4301330718 9131 |[FEE OW s ]
EULA-UTE 1-16A1 7716 |o10s1010W [4301330782[8443 FEE __|OW S )
JESSEN 1-15A4 15 |010S [040W |4301330817 [9345 |FEE oW s B
R HOUSTON 1-22Z1 22 |010N [010W [4301330884 [936 |FEE ow s |
FIELDSTED 2-27A4 7127 |010S]040W [4301330915(9632 FEE  |OW S )
HANSKUTT 2-23B5 B |23 [020S |050W |4301330917 [9600 |FEE ow [ )
TIMOTHY 3-18A3 18 |010S [030W 4301330940 (9633 [FEE ow s |
BROTHERSON 2-3B4 103 [020S |040W 4301331008 (10165 [FEE ow s |
BROTHERSON 2-22B4 22 |020S [040W 4301331086(1782 FEE ___OW 8 |
MILES 2-35A4 135 |010S |040W |4301331087 |1966 |FEE ow 1§ T ]
ELLSWORTH 2-17B4 ] |17 020S |040W 4301331089 [1696 |FEE ow s T
RUST 2-36A4 |36 |010S |040W 4301331092[1577 [FEE ____ ow s |
EVANS 2-19B3 19 10205 [030W 4301331113 1777 |FEE ow s N
FARNSWORTH 2-1285 " 112 [020S [050W 4301331115 [1646 |FEE oW [S N
CHRISTENSEN34B4 04 |020S|040W 4301331142 10481 FEE  |OW S
ROBERTSON 229A2 29 1010S [020W [4301331150 | 10679 |FEE low s |
[CEDAR RIM 2A 20 [030S [060W 14301331172 110671 |FEE oW s

8



El Paso E9 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E9 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HARTMAN 2-31A3 31_[010S |030W |4301331243 [ 11026 |FEE SEE —
GOODRICH2-2B3 ] 02 |020S |030W 4301331246 | 11037 |FEE ow s )
JESSEN 2-21A4 21 |010S |040W |4301331256 | 11061 |FEE ~ low s
BROTHERSON 3-23B4 23 |020S [040W |4301331289 [11141 [FEE ow s

MYRIN RANCH 2-18B3 18 |020S |030W |4301331297 [11475 |FEE T low s
BROTHERSON 2-2B5 02 |020S [050W (4301331302 [11342 [FEE ow S ]
DASTRUP 2-30A3 30 |010S [030W (4301331320 [11253 |FEE ow s

YOUNG 2-30B4 30 |020S [040W 4301331366 | 11453 |FEE ow s

IORG 2-10B3 10 |020S |030W [4301331388 [11482 [FEE oW |s

MONSEN 3-27A3 27 |010S [030W 4301331401 |11686 |FEE low s
HORROCKS 2-5B1E 05 |020S [010E 4304732409 11481 FEE T Tlow I8

LARSEN 1-25A1 25 |010S [010W |4304730552 815 | FEE ow [TA

DRY GULCH 1-36A1 36 010S |010W 4304730569 820 FEE ow__ [TA




Sundry Nunber: 57783 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 14.20.H62-1704 '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below

current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION | 7-UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well UTE TRIBAL 2-34Z2
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P. 43013311670000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext BLUEBELL
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1223 FSL 1957 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: SESW Section: 34 Township: 01.0N Range: 02.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
] NOTICE OF INTENT [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
v" SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D D |:|
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION v’ OTHER OTHER: ISee Below

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Upsize RTF & lower pump. See attached for details. Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
November 17, 2014

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 11/12/2014

RECEI VED: Nov. 12, 2014




Sundry Nunber: 57783 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000

CENTRAL DIVISION

ALTAMONT FIELD
UTE TRIBAL 2-3422
UTE TRIBAL 2-34Z2
WORKOVER LAND

Operation Summary Report

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s)
does (do) not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the
possession or use of the report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this
report or any part thereof, is solely at the user’s own risk.

RECEI VED: Nov. 12, 2014



Sundry Nunber: 57783 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000

CENTRAL DIVISION
1 General

1.1 Customer Information
Company CENTRAL DIVISION
Representative
Address

1.2 Well Information
Well UTE TRIBAL 2-34Z2
Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site UTE TRIBAL 2-34Z2
Rig Name/No. BASIC/1544 Event WORKOVER LAND
Start date 7/1/2014 End date 8/27/2014
Spud Date/Time 6/19/1986 uwi 034-001-N 002-W 30
Active datum KB @5,922.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)
Afe 163301/51978 / UTE TRIBAL 2-34Z2
No./Description

2 Summary
21 Operation Summary
Date Time Duratio Phase |Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
7/3/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, RIGGING UP RIG

HOT OILER PUMPING DOWN CSG W/ 2% KCL @ 200 DEG, HOLE
IS FULL CIRC TO TREATER

7:30 9:00 1.50 MIRU 01 P SPOT & RIG UP RIG.

9:00 11:30 2.50 WOR 18 P L/D POLISH ROD & 2' SUB, P/U 1" WORK ROD, ATTEMPT TO
WORK PUMP OFF SEAT.
UNABLE, BACK OFF RODS.

11:30 14:30 3.00 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 112-1" EL RODS, 87-7/8" EL RODS,
( CHECKING BREAKS ) VERY WAXY.

14:30 16:00 1.50 WLWORK 21 P MIRU THE PERFORATORS, RIH W/ 1 9/16" TBG PUNCH LOADED

4 SPF, COULD ONLY GET IN HOLE TO 1121', TRY TO WORK

THROUGH WAX, UNABLE TO MAKE ANY HOLE, POOH R/D WL
16:00 17:00 1.00 WOR 16 P X/O TO TBG EQUIP,CSG FLOWING , LEAVE TO TREATER.

TBG SHUT IN, SDFN

2% KCL PUMPED = 280 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 88 GAL
PROPANE USED = 300 GAL

7/4/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, RELEASING TAC
7:30 8:30 1.00 WOR 16 P N/D WH, N/U BOPS, RIG UP FLOOR & TBG EQUIP.
8:30 10:00 1.50 WOR 18 P ATTEMPT TO RELEASE TAC W/ TONGS
10:00 16:30 6.50 WOR 18 P R/U POWER SWIVEL, CONT TO ATTEMPT TO RELEASE TAC,

WORKING UP TO 120K, UNABLE TO GET TAC RELEASED.
16:30 17:00 0.50 WOR 39 P R/D POWER SWIVEL, X/O TO ROD EQUIP, HOT OILER START

PUMPING DOWN CSG W/ 2% KCL @ 220 DEG,

RIH W/ 48-7/8" EL RODS, STARTED STACKING OUT ON WAX,

P/U POLISH ROD,

SECURE WELL, CSG TO TREATER, TBG SHUT IN, SDFN..

2% KCL PUMPED = 200 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 80 GAL PROPANE USED = 200 GAL

7/8/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, RIH W/ RODS
5 AM HOT OILER START PUMPING DOWN CSG W/ 2% KCL @
250 DEG.
November 12, 2014 at 4:05 pm 1 OienWeIIs
RECEI VED: Nov. 12, 2014



Sundry Nunber: 57783 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000

CENTRAL DIVISION
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase Activit | Sub OoP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
7:30 11:00 3.50 WOR 39 P EOR @ 1200', CONT RIH W/ 37-7/8" RODS, WORKING THROUGH

WAX FROM 1200' TO 2000', 112-1" RODS, P/U 5-1" WORK
RODS, SCREW INTO ROD STRING @ 4925, L/D 2-1" WORK
RODS, ATTEMPT TO WORK PUMP OFFSEAT,ACTS LIKE PIN
PULLED OUT OF BOX.

11:00 13:00 2.00 WOR 39 P L/D 3-1" WORK RODS, POOH W/ 112-1" RODS, 114-7/8" RODS,
10 -3/4",L/D BOTTOM 3/4" THREADS PULLED ON PIN..
13:00 18:00 5.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 2 5/16" OS W/ 1 5/8" SLEEVE,9-3/4" RODS 114-7/8"

EL RODS, 112-1" EL RODS, ( WORK THROUGH WAX FROM
1400'-2200' )P/U 6-1" WORK RODS, LATCH FISH @ 5950',
ATTEMPT TO WORK PUMP OFFSEAT, CLUTCHS ON RIG
STARTED SLIPPING & HEATING UP, PULL 20K OVER, LEAVE
PULLED OVER, SHUT WELL IN, CSG TO TREATER, SDFN.

2% KCL PUMPED = 1400 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 88 GAL
PROPANE USED = 1500 GAL
719/12014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, BACKING OFF RODS
0 PSI TBG, 20# FCP
6 AM HOT OILER START PUMPING DOWN CSG W/ 2% KCL @
250 DEG @ 3 BBLS MIN

7:30 8:30 1.00 WOR 18 N REPAIR CLUTCH ON RIG, NO CHARGE TO EP

8:30 10:00 1.50 WOR 18 P LEFT ROD STRING IN 20K TENSION, NO CHANGE OVERNIGHT,
ATTEMPT TO UNSEAT PUMP, NO LUCK, BACK OFF RODS

10:00 12:00 2.00 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 112-1" RODS, 114-7/8" RODS,10-3/4" RODS, L/D
OS,CONT OOH W/ 39-3/4" TO BACKED ROD ROD @ 6925'

12:00 16:30 4.50 WOR 39 P RIH CHECKING EVERY BREAK W/ 47- 3/4" EL RODS, 114-7/8"

EL RODS, 112-1" EL RODS, P/U 7-1" WORK RODS, SCREW INTO
RODS @ 6925', TORQUE UP RODS, ATTEMPT TO UNSEAT PUMP,
NO LUCK, BACK OFF RODS, WEIGHING 14K, STRING WEIGHT 20
K, L/D WORK RODS.

16:30 19:00 2.50 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 112-1" RODS, 116-7/8" EL RODS, 3-3/4" EL RODS,.
5775'
TBG SHUT IN, CSG TO SALES, SDFN.

2% KCL PUMPED = 500 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 96 GAL
PROPANE USED = 600 GAL
7/10/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, BACKING OFF RODS
7:30 9:00 1.50 WOR 18 P WHILE PREPARING TO RIH TO SCREW INTO & BACK OFF RODS,
SHAFT ON MAINDRUM TWISTED OFF, SECURE WELL, SDFN,
SHUT DOWN FOR REPAIRS.

DIESEL USED = 16 GAL

7/12/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, RIH W/ RODS

7:30 10:00 2.50 WOR 16 P LAND TBG ON HANGER, N/D BOPS, R/U PUMP TEE, HOT OILER

START PUMPING DOWN CSG, HANGER LEAKING BAD, SHUT
DOWN HOT OILER.
R/D PUMP TEE, UNLAND TBG, STRIP ON & N/U BOPS. CLOSE
PIPE RAMS
HOT OILER START PUMPING DOWN CSG W/ 2% KCL @ 250 DEG
X/O TO ROD EQUIP, R/U FLOOR

November 12, 2014 at 4:05 pm 2 ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Nov. 12, 201%




Sundry Nunber :

57783 AP

Vel |

Nunber :
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CENTRAL DIVISION

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date

Time

Start-End

Duratio
n
(hr)

Phase

Activit
y

Sub

OP
Code

MD from
(ft)

Operation

7/13/2014

7/15/2014

7/16/2014

10:00

13:30

16:00

17:30

6:00

7:30
9:00

11:00

6:00

7:30

15:00

17:30

6:00

7:30

13:30

16:00

17:30

18:00

7:30

9:00
11:00

18:00

7:30

15:00

17:30

20:30

7:30

9:00

3.50

2.50

1.50

0.50

1.50

1.50
2.00

7.00

1.50

7.50

2.50

3.00

1.50

1.50

WOR

WOR

WLWORK

WOR

WOR

WOR
WOR

WOR

WOR

WOR

WOR

WOR

WOR

WOR

39

39

21

18

28

18
18

18

28

18

35

18

28

18

RIHCHECKING EVERY BREAK, W/ 3-3/4" EL RODS, 114-7/8",
112-1" EL RODS, P/U 5-1" WORK RODS, SCREW INTO ROD
STRING @ 5775', ATTEMPT TO UNSEAT PUMP, NO LUCK, BACK
OFF RODS,

POOH L/D 5-1" WORK RODS, 112-1" 114-7/8",

POOH L/D 5-1" WORK RODS, 112-1" 114-7/8", 78-3/4" RODS,
7725'

MIRU THE PERFORATORS, RIH W/ 1 9/16" TBG PUNCH LOADED
4 SPF, TAG @ 7724' WLD, PERF TBG FROM 7690'-7691', POOH
R/D WL

X/O TO TBG EQUIP, TBG SHUT IN, CSG TO SALES, SDFN.

2% KCL PUMPED = 650 GAL

DIESEL USED = 96 GAL

PROPANE USED = 750 GAL

TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, R/U POWER SWIVEL

SITP 504, FCP 50#, LEAVE CSG TO TREATER.

6 AM HOT OILER FLUSH TBG W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL @ 200 DEG.
R/U POWER SWIVEL, ATTEMPT TO RELEASE TAC

R/U BAKER CHEM TO TBG, PUMP 1DRUM PARAFFIN SOLVENT, 1
DRUM SCALE INHIBITOR, 5 DRUMS ACID, HOT OILER PUMP 43
BBLS 2% KCL, TO FLUSH TO TBG PERFS @ 7690-7691' SHUT
TBG IN, R/U TO CSG PUMP 44 BBLS 2% KCL TO SPOTACID @
TAC @ 9202

CONT TO ATTEMPT TO RELEASE TAC W/ POWER SWIVEL,
WORKING TO 100K,

DIDNT GAIN ANY MOVEMENT, TBG SHUT IN, CSG TO SALES.
SDFN.

2% KCL PUMPED = 270 BBLS

DIESEL USED =92 GAL

PROPANE USED = 250 GAL

TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, RELEASING TAC W/ POWER
SWIVEL

100# SITP, LEAVE SHUT IN, 50# FCP, LEAVE TO TREATER.
CONTINUE TO ATTEMPT TO RELEASE TAC W/ POWER SWIVEL.
WORKING TO 100K

R/U BAKER TO TBG, HSM, PUMP 5000 GAL 15% HCL, ACID
WASH, FLUSH W/ 88 BBLS

2% KCLTO TAC

MAX PSI =850#

MAX RATE = 3.5 bbls min

ISIP=0 PSI

CSG PSI WHILE PUMPING 400 PSI.

R/D BAKER

CONT TO ATTEMPT TO RELEASE TAC, NO LUCK

HOT OILER R/U TO TBG, FLUSH ACID TO PERFS W/ 40 BBLS 2%
KCL

2% KCL PUMPED = 160 BBLS

DIESEL USED = 120 GAL

PROPANE USED = 50 GAL

TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, R/D POWER SWIVEL

SITP & SICP, 100#, OPEN CSG TO TREATER.

CONT TO ATTEMPT TO RELEASE TAC W/ POWER SWIVEL, NO
LUCK, R/D POWER SWIVEL

November 12, 2014 at 4:05 pm

ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Nov. 12, 201%




Sundry Nunber: 57783 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000

CENTRAL DIVISION
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase Activit | Sub OoP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
9:00 12:00 3.00 WOR 18 P LAND TBG ON HANGER, N/D BOPS, N/U WH, X/O TO RODS.

HOT OILER PUMP 150 BBLS 2% KCL DOWN TBG @ 250 DEG, 40
BBLS 10# BRINE
12:00 16:00 4.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 2 5/16" OS W/ 1 1/2" SLEEVE, 114-7/8" RODS,
195-1" RODS LATCH ON TO RODS @ 7725',L/D 2-1" RODS,
ATTEMPT TO WORK OFF SEAT, NO LUCK, BACK OFF RODS
16:00 18:00 2.00 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 193-1" RODS, 114-7/8" RODS, OS, CONT OOH W/ 15
-3/4"
8100' RODS OOH.
TBG & CSG, SHUT IN, SDFN

2% KCL PUMPED = 200 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 96 GAL
PROPANE USED = 150 GAL
7/17/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, RIH W/ RODS

SICP 100#, SITP 0
HOT OILER PUMP 200 BBLS 2% KCL @ 200 DEG DOWN TBG, 20
BBLS BRINE

7:30 11:00 3.50 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 2 5/16" OS W/ 1 1/2" SLEEVE, 114-7/8" EL RODS,
210-1" RODS,CHECKING EVERY BREAK, LATCH ON TO RODS
@ 8100', L/D 2 - 1" RODS.

11:00 13:30 2.50 WOR 18 P ATTEMPT TO UNSEAT PUMP WORKING TO 60K, NO LUCK,,
BACK OFF RODS

(NOTE, CSG FLOWING BACK DIRTY WATER, W/ ACID SMELL,
CHECKING PH, RANGING FROM 4-7 )

13:30 16:00 2.50 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 208-1" RODS, 114-7/8" RODS, OS, CONT OOH W/
10-3/4" RODS.TOTAL RODS OOH 8350'
16:00 18:00 2.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 2 5/16" OS W/ 1 1/2" SLEEVE, 114-7/8" EL RODS,

132-1" RODS,CHECKING EVERY BREAK, EOR @ 6150',
TBG & CSG SHUT IN, SDFN.

2% KCL PUMPED = 200 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 88 GAL
PROPANE USED = 200 GAL
7/18/2014 6:00 8:00 2.00 WOR 28 P BASIC HAD CO. SAFETY MTG
TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, BACKING OFF RODS
SITP 0, SICP 50#, BLEED OFF CSG

8:00 10:00 2.00 WOR 39 P EOR @ 6150', RIH CHECKING EVERY BREAK W/ 89-1" RODS,
LATCH ON TO RODS, PICK UP, NO WEIGHT GAIN.

10:00 12:30 2.50 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 220-1" RODS, 114-7/8" RODS, OS, 1-3/4" RODS, 8375'
RODS TOTAL.

12:30 14:30 2.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 2 5/16" OS W/ 1 1/2" SLEEVE, 114-7/8" EL RODS,
221-1" RODS, LATCH ON TO RODS, L/D 2-1" RODS, BACK OFF
RODS.

14:30 16:30 2.00 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 219-1" RODS, 60-7/8" RODS. ( L/D BTM 7/8"

16:30 18:00 1.50 WOR 39 P RIH W/ /59-7/8" RODS, 161-1" RODS, EOR @ 5500'

TBG & CSG SHUT IN, SDFN.

DIESEL USED = 80 GAL

7/19/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, BACKING OFF RODS
SITP 0, SICP 50#, BLEED OFF CSG
7:30 8:30 1.00 WOR 39 P EOR @ 5500', CONT IN HOLE CHECKING EVERY BREAK W/

61-1" RODS, SCREW INTO ROD STRING, TORQUE UP, L/D 2-1"
RODS, BACK OFF RODS.

November 12, 2014 at 4:05 pm 4 ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Nov. 12, 201%




Sundry Nunber: 57783 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000
CENTRAL DIVISION
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
8:30 10:30 2.00 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 220-1" EL RODS, 113-7/8" , OS, 36-3/4" RODS, 9275'
TOTAL
10:30 12:00 1.50 WOR 18 P X/O TO TBG EQUIP, TIE BACK SINGLE LINE, N/D WH, N/U BOPS,
R/U FLOOR
12:00 15:00 3.00 WLWORK = 18 P MIRU SINGLE SHOT WIRELINE, RIH FREEPOINT TBG, TAG @
9280' WLD, TAC @ 9220' WLD, RIH W/ 2 1/8" CHEM CUTTER,
CUT TBG @ 9205' WLD, 60% FREE, POOH R/D WL.
15:00 18:00 3.00 WOR 39 P WORK TBG FREE, POOH W/ 243 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D
PERFORATED JT, CONT OOH W/ 47 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D
CUT OFF JT.
( NOTE = TBG HANGING UP EVERY 30', W/ EOT @ 5400', TBG
QUIT HANGING UP)
TBG & CSG SHUT IN, SDFN
DIESEL USED = 92 GAL
7/20/2014 | 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM R/U & R/D WIRELINE.
20# SICP, BLEED OFF.
7:30 12:30 5.00 WLWORK = 22 P MIRU SINGLE SHOT WIRELINE, RUN 4.68" GAUGE RING, CSG
APPEARS PARTED @ 1700', WORK THROUGH, RIH, STACK OUT
@ 3084', POOH, RIH W 3" JUNK BASKET & 3 1/8" CCL, ABLE TO
WORK THROUGH BAD SPOT @ 3084', RIH TO 9150', POOH ,
LOGGED FROM 9000'-1600', BAD SPOT @ 6000', POOH P/U 3
15/16" GAUGE RING RIH TO 9180', DIDNT TAG ANYTHING, POOH
HUNG UP @ 1700', L/D TOOLS, R/D WIRELINE,.
CSG SHUT IN, SDFN.
DIESEL USED = 44 GAL
7/24/2014 | 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, R/U & R/D WIRELINE
20# SICP, BLEED OFF
7:30 12:30 5.00 WLWORK = 37 P EP SAFETY COACH ORIENTATE CASED HOLE SOLUTIONS
GREW.
MIRU CASED HOLE SOLUTIONS, RIH W/ 2 3/4" O.D. 40 ARM
CSG CALIPER,
LOG FROM 8000’ - 1600’
TIGHT SPOT @ 3060' WLD, 5.171" 1.D
POSSIBLE HOLE @ 2650' WLD
CASING PARTED @ 1690' WLD
12:30 15:00 2.50 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH TALLYING W/ 3 5/8" O.D HYDRAULIC CUTTER, X/O
SUB, X/O SUB, 2-3 1/2" DRILL COLLARS, X/O SUB 97 JTS 2 7/8"
N-80EUE TBG,
TAGGGED PART @ 1720' SLMD.
15:00 16:30 1.50 WBREMD = 45 P R/U POWER SWIVEL, START PUMPING DOWN TBG W/ RIG PUMP,
CUT CSG @ 3124' SLMD, R/D POWER SWIVEL,
16:30 18:00 1.50 WOR 39 P L/D 1-JT 2 7/8" N-80 TBG,POOH W/ 96 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D
X/O SUB, 2-3 1/2" DRILL COLLARS, X/O SUB, X/O SUB, 2 3/4"
HYDRAULIC CUTTER.
CLOSE BLIND RAMS, CSG SHUT IN, SDFN.
2% KCL PUMPED 80 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 88 GAL
7/25/2014 | 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, N/D & N/U BOPS

25# SICP, BLEED OFF

November 12, 2014 at 4:05 pm

2 8ie&Wells

RECEI VED: Nov. 12,




Sundry Nunber: 57783 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000

CENTRAL DIVISION
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase Activit | Sub OoP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
7:30 13:30 6.00 WOR 06 P R/U TO CSG PUMP DOWN 7" CSG, RETURN UP 9 5/8" CIRCULATE

VOL 112 BBLS 2% KCL, CIRC W/ 112 BBLS 10# BRINE.
P/U PIPE RACKS & CATWALK.
R/D FLOOR, N/D 7 1/16" BOPS, SPEAR CSG, PULL UP TO 130K,
CAME FREE, RELAND CSG, L/D SPEAR, N/U 11" BOPS & C/O
SPOOL. R/U FLOOR & CSG CREW.

13:30 18:00 4.50 WOR 39 P P/U SPEAR, SPEAR CSG, PULL UP REMOVE SLIPS, L/D CSG
STUB & SPEAR, POOH & LD 40 JTS 7" CSG. 1710' SLMD
R/D CASING CREW
CLOSE BLIND RAMS, CSG SHUT IN, SDFN.

2% KCL PUMPED = 200 BBLS
DIESEL USED 88 GAL

7/26/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, L/D CASING
25# SICP, BLEED OFF.
7:30 8:30 1.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 7" CSG SPEAR, 4 3/4" O.D BUMPER SUB, 4 3/4"

0O.D JARS, 54 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, SPEAR CASING @ 1720'
SLMD, TBG & SPEAR WGT 10K, PULL UP TO 25K SET JARS OF
ONE TIME, CAME FREE, WEIGHING 35K, SHOULD BE 50K

8:30 11:00 2.50 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 54 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D JARS, BUMPER SUB, X/O
TO CSG EQUIP, L/D SPEAR & 1 JT 7" CSG, POOH W/ 16 JTS 7"
CSG, 2381' TOTAL CSG OOH,( POSSIBLY ANOTHER COLLAR
SPLIT) R/D CSG EQUIP.

11:00 13:00 2.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 7" CSG SPEAR, 4 3/4" O.D BUMPER SUB, 4 3/4"
0O.D JARS, 76 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, SPEAR CASING @ 2381
SLMD, PICK UP PULLED FREE, WEIGHING 32K,

13:00 15:30 2.50 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 76 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D JARS, BUMPER SUB, X/O
TO CSG, L/D SPEAR & 1 JT CSG, CONT OOH W/ 9 JTS CSG.
2788' TOTAL CSG OOH.
( WHILE PULLING OOH W/ 8 JTS OUT, , LOST 6K WEIGHT,
APPEARS ANOTHER COLLAR SPLIT, DROPPING 6K CSG TO CUT
)

15:30 17:00 1.50 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 7" CSG SPEAR, 4 3/4" O.D BUMPER SUB, 4 3/4"
0.D JARS, 89 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, SPEAR CASING @ 2788
SLMD, PICK UP PULLED FREE, WEIGHING 32K,

17:00 19:00 2.00 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 89 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D JARS, BUMPER SUB, X/O
TO CSG, L/D SPEAR & 1 JT CSG, CONT OOH W/ 6 JTS &
PARTED JT , PARTED @ 3060' SLMD.
CLOSE BLIND RAMS, CSG SHUT IN, SDFN.

DIESEL USED = 96 GAL

7/27/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, TRIPPING TUBING
20# SICP, BLEED OFF
7:30 9:00 1.50 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 7" CSG SPEAR, 4 3/4" O.D BUMPER SUB, 4 3/4"

0O.D JARS, 97 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, SPEAR CASING @ 3060
SLMD, P/U GAINED 1K.

9:00 11:30 2.50 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 97 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D JARS, BUMPER SUB,
SPEAR, NO CSG
( WAS HANGING UP LAST 14 JTS )

11:30 14:30 3.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 7" CSG SPEAR, 4 3/4" O.D BUMPER SUB, 4 3/4"
0.D JARS, RIH W/ 3 JTS TAG FISH, ATTEMPT TO SPEAR , FISH
FELL, CONT IN W/ 94 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, SPEAR CSG. GAINED
1K WEIGHT

November 12, 2014 at 4:05 pm 6 ienWeIIs
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Sundry Nunber: 57783 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000

CENTRAL DIVISION

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
14:30 18:00 3.50 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 94 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, FISH HANGING UP @ 115'

ATTEMPT TO WORK FREE, GRAPPLE SLIPPED OFF, POOH W/ 3
JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, JARS, BUMPER SUB & SPEAR.
BLIND RAMS CLOSED, CSG SHUT IN, SDFN.

DIESEL USED = 88 GAL

7/28/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, P/U DRILL COLLARS
20# SICP, BLEED OFF
7:30 12:30 5.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 8 5/8" STRING MILL,X/O SUB, 2-4 3/4" DRILL

COLLARS, X/O SUB, 2 JTS, 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, STRIP ON
WASHINGTON HEAD, R/U POWER SWIVEL, BREAK CIRC REV,
W/ 2 BBLS 2% KCL, START MILLING @ 118' MAKE 3' TO 121/,
FELL FREE, DRESS UP TIGHT SPOT, R/D POWER SWIVEL, RIH W/
12 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG TO 524" '( STARTED DRAGGING W/ FISH
@ 480') DIDNT TAG ANYTHING.

7:30 7:30 0.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 8 5/8" SHOE, X/O SUB, 4 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG,
STACKED OUT @ 118', UNABLE TO WORK THROUGH, POOH W/
4 JTS 27/8" TBG, L/D SHOE

12:30 14:00 1.50 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 12 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, STRIP OFF WASHINTON
HEAD, CONT OOH W/ 2 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D 2-4 3/4" DRILL
COLLARS, 8 5/8" STRING MILL

14:00 15:00 1.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 7" CSG SPEAR, 4 3/4" O.D BUMPER SUB, 4 3/4"
0.D JARS, RIH W/ 97 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, SPEAR CSG.
GAINED 1K WEIGHT

15:00 17:00 2.00 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 97 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D BUMPER SUB, JARS,
SPEAR & 2 PARTIAL JTS CSG,( 3100' CSG OOH).
CLOSE BLIND RAMS, SHUT CSG IN, SDFN.

2% KCL PUMPED = 50 BBLS
DIESEL USED =80 GAL

7/29/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, R/U PWR SWIVEL
20# SICP, BLEED OFF
7:30 9:00 1.50 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 8 5/8" OD SKIRTED MILL, 4-4 3/4" DRILL COLLARS,

X/O SUB, 94 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, STRIP ON WASH HEAD, R/U
POWER SWIVEL, P/U 1 JT 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, BREAK CIRC REV
W/ 2 BBLS 2% KCL

9:00 13:00 4.00 WOR 18 P TAG FISH TOP @ 3097', MILL & DRESS FISH TOP TO 3099', CIRC
CLEAN, L/D 1 JT 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, R/D POWER SWIVEL, STRIP
OFF WASHINGTON HEAD.

13:00 14:30 1.50 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 94 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, X/O SUB, 4-4 3/4" DRILL
COLLARS, 8 5/8" SKIRTED MILL,
14:30 16:30 2.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 7" CSG SPEAR, 4 3/4" O.D BUMPER SUB, X/O 99

JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, SPEAR CSG @ 3098' P/U ON CSG, PULLED
6K OVER STARTED PULIING FREE

16:30 18:00 1.50 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 95, JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, CLOSE PIPE RAMS, TBG &
CSG SHUT IN, SDFN

2% KCL PUMPED = 200 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 88 GAL

7/30/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, LAYING DOWN CASING
25# SICP, 0 PSI TUBING, BLEED OFF CSG
7:30 10:00 2.50 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 4 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D BUMPER SUB & SPEAR, 8
JTS & PARTIAL JT 7" CSG 350", TOTAL CSG OOH 3446'
10:00 13:00 3.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 3 5/8" HYDRAULIC CSG CUTTER, X/O SUB, X/O

SUB, 4 3/4" JARS, X/O SUB, 110 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, R/U
POWER SWIVEL, START PUMPING DOWN TBG, CUT CSG @
3470'
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Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)

13:00 14:30 1.50 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 110 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D X/O SUB, JARS, X/O
SUB, X/O SUB,CUTTER

14:30 15:30 1.00 WOR 39 P RIH W/ 7" CSG SPEAR, STOP SUB, X/O SUB, 4 3/4" BUMPER
SUB, 4 3/4" JARS, X/O SUB, 110 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, SPEAR
CSG @ 3446'

15:30 18:00 2.50 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 110 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D X/O SUB, JARS,

BUMPER SUB, TO SPEAR,DIDNT GET CUT, CSG APPEARS TO
HAVE BEEN SPINNING FREE BELOW ( POSSIBLE SPLIT COLLAR
) HAVE AT LEAST 2 JTS CSG, RIH W/ 2 X/O &2 JTS 2 7/8" TBG.
CLOSE PIPE RAMS, CSG SHUT IN, SDFN.

2% KCL PUMPED = 100 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 88 GAL

7/31/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, L/D CSG
20# SICP, 0 PSI TBG, BLEED CSG OFF
7:30 8:30 1.00 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 2 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D SPEAR & 2 JTS CSG,

77.50', TOTAL CSG OOH 3523'
(CUTTER DIDNT CUT )

8:30 10:30 2.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 5 3/4" CENTRALIZER SUB, 3 5/8" HYDRAULIC CSG
CUTTER, X/O SUB, X/O SUB, 4 3/4" JARS, X/O SUB, 112 JTS 2
7/8" N-80 TBG, UNABLE TO GET IN FISH TOP

10:30 12:00 1.50 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 112 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D X/O SUB, JARS, X/O
SUB, X/O SUB,CUTTER, CENTRALIZER
12:00 15:30 3.50 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 6 1/4" TAPERED MILL, X/O SUB, 4 3/4" JARS, X/O

SUB, 112 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, TAG FISH TOP @ 3523', R/U
POWER SWIVEL, BREAK CIRC REV, START MILLING, WORK
MILL THROUGH FISH TOP, CIRC CLEAN, R/D POWER SWIVEL

15:30 17:00 1.50 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 112 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D X/O SUB, JARS, X/O
SUB, 6 1/4" TAPERED MILL.
17:00 19:00 2.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 2 3/8" N-80 TBG SUB,X/O SUB, 5 3/4"

CENTRALIZER SUB, 3 5/8" HYDRAULIC CSG CUTTER, X/O SUB,
X/O SUB, 4 3/4" JARS, X/O SUB, 112 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG,
UNABLE TO WORK INSIDE FISH TOP.

19:00 20:00 1.00 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 32 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, EOT 2622', TBG & CSG SHUT
IN, SDFN.

2% KCL PUMPED = 100 BBLS
DIESEL USED 120 GAL

8/1/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, TIH W/ TBG
SITP 0 PSI, 20# SICP, BLEED OFF
7:30 8:00 0.50 WOR 39 P EOT @ 2622', POOH W/ 82 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D X/O SUB,
JARS, X/O SUB,CUTTER, CENTRALIZER, 8'-2 3/8" TBG SUB.
8:00 11:00 3.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 5 1/2" LIP GUIDE SHOE,TOP SUB, X/O SUB, X/O

SUB, X/O SUB, CENTRALIZER, 3 5/8" HYDRAULIC CUTTER, X/O
SUB, X/O SUB, 4 3/4" JARS, X/O SUB, 112 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG,

R/U POWER SWIVEL, WORK INSIDE FISH TOP @ 3523'., START
PUMPING DOWN TBG, CUT CSG @ 3545', R/D POWER SWIVEL.

11:00 13:00 2.00 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 82 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D X/O SUB, JARS, X/O
SUB,CUTTER, CENTRALIZER,X/O SUB, CUT LIP SHOE
13:00 15:00 2.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 5 1/2" LIP GUIDE SHOE,TOP SUB, X/O SUB, X/O

SUB, X/O SUB, 7" CSG SPEAR, STOP SUB, X/O SUB, 4 3/4"
BUMPER SUB, 4 3/4" JARS, X/O SUB, 112 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG,
SPEAR CSG @ 3523'
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Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
15:00 18:00 3.00 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 112 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D X/O SUB, JARS,

BUMPER SUB, SPEAR, L/D 3 JTS CSG TO 3651'.( CSG WASNT
CUT, POSSIBLE SPLIT COLLAR )
CLOSE BLIND RAMS, SHUT CSG IN, SDFN

DIESEL USED 108 GA

8/2/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, P/U FISHING TOOLS
20# SICP, BLEED OFF
7:30 11:00 3.50 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 6 1/4" TAPERED MILL, 4 3/4" BUMPER SUB, 4 3/4"

JARS, X/O SUB, 116 JTS 2 7/8" TBG TAG FISH TOP @ 3651', R/U
POWER SWIVEL, BREAK CIRC REV, DRESS UP FISH TOP, R/D
POWER SWIVEL, RIH TO 3766", TAG UP , R/lU POWER SWIVEL
BREAK CIRC REV, UNABLE TO MAKE ANYHOLE.

11:00 12:30 1.50 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 120 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D X/O SUB, JARS,
BUMPER SUB, TAPERED MILL
12:30 14:30 2.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 5 1/2" LIP GUIDE SHOE,TOP SUB, X/O SUB, X/O

SUB, X/O SUB, 7" CSG SPEAR, STOP SUB, X/O SUB, 4 3/4"
BUMPER SUB, 4 3/4" JARS, X/O SUB, 116 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG,
SPEAR CSG @ 3651' P/U ON CSG PULL 3K OVER PULLED FREE

14:30 17:00 2.50 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 116 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D X/O SUB, JARS,
BUMPER SUB, SPEAR, L/D 1 JTS CSG TO 3692".
17:00 18:00 1.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 5 1/2" LIP GUIDE SHOE,TOP SUB, X/O SUB, X/O

SUB, X/O SUB, 7" CSG SPEAR, STOP SUB, X/O SUB, 4 3/4"
BUMPER SUB, 4 3/4" JARS, X/O SUB, 98 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG,
EOT @ 3132".

TBG & CSG SHUT IN, SDFN.

DIESEL USED = 120 GAL

8/3/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, L/D CSG
0 PSI TBG, 20 SICP, BLEED OFF.
7:30 8:30 1.00 WOR 39 P EOT @ 3122', RIH SPEAR CSG @ 3692', P/U GAINED 1k
8:30 11:00 2.50 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 118 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D X/O SUB, JARS,
BUMPER SUB, SPEAR, L/D 1 JTS CSG TO 3692'.
11:00 12:00 1.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 5 1/2" LIP GUIDE SHOE,TOP SUB, X/O SUB, X/O

SUB, X/O SUB, 7" CSG SPEAR, STOP SUB, X/O SUB, 4 3/4"
BUMPER SUB, 4 3/4" JARS, X/O SUB, 120 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG,
SPEAR CSG @ 3725' P/U ON CSG PULL 2K OVER PULLED FREE

12:00 15:00 3.00 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 118 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D X/O SUB, JARS,
BUMPER SUB, SPEAR, L/D 1 JTS CSG TO 3725'".
15:00 17:00 2.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 5 1/2" LIP GUIDE SHOE,TOP SUB, X/O SUB, X/O

SUB, X/O SUB, 7" CSG SPEAR, STOP SUB, X/O SUB, 4 3/4"
BUMPER SUB, 4 3/4" JARS, X/O SUB, 120 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG,
SPEAR CSG @ 3765' P/U ON CSG PULL 1K OVER PULLED FREE
17:00 17:30 0.50 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 118 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D X/O SUB, JARS,
BUMPER SUB, SPEAR, LOST FISH WHILE POOH
CLOSE BLIND RAMS, CSG SHUT IN, SDFN.
17:30 18:30 1.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 5 1/2" LIP GUIDE SHOE,TOP SUB, X/O SUB, X/O
SUB, X/O SUB, 7" CSG SPEAR, STOP SUB, X/O SUB, 4 3/4"
BUMPER SUB, 4 3/4" JARS, X/O SUB, 120 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG,
SPEAR CSG @ 3765' P/U ON CSG PULL 1K OVER PULLED FREE
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Date
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n
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8/4/2014

8/5/2014

8/6/2014

18:30 19:00

6:00 7:30

7:30 9:00

9:00 10:30

10:30 12:00

12:00 14:00

14:00 16:00

16:00 20:30

20:30 21:30

6:00 7:30

7:30 8:30

8:30 10:00

10:00 18:00

18:00 20:30

6:00 7:30

7:30 12:30

0.50

1.50

1.50

1.50

1.50

2.00

2.00

4.50

1.00

1.50

1.00

1.50

8.00

2.50

1.50

5.00

WOR

WOR

WOR

WOR

WOR

WOR

WOR

WOR

WOR

WOR

WOR

WOR

WOR

WLWORK

WOR

WOR

39

28

39

39

39

39

39

39

39

28

39

18

39

27

28

16

POOH W/ 26 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, EOT @ 3006’
TBG & CSG SHUT IN, SDFN.

DIESEL USED = 96 GAL

TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, TOOH W/ TBG

SITP 0, 20 SICP, BLEED OFF

EOT @ 3006', POOH W /94 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D X/O SUB,
JARS, BUMPER SUB, SPEAR, L/D 1 JTS CSG TO 3802'.

P/U & RIH W/ 5 1/2" LIP GUIDE SHOE,TOP SUB, X/O SUB, X/O
SUB, X/O SUB, 7" CSG SPEAR, STOP SUB, X/O SUB, 4 3/4"
BUMPER SUB, 4 3/4" JARS, X/O SUB, 122 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG,
SPEAR CSG @ 3802' P/U ON CSG PULL 12K OVER PULLED
FREE, GAINED 2K

POOH W/ 122 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D X/O SUB, JARS,
BUMPER SUB, SPEAR, L/D 1 JTS CSG TO 3844'.

P/U & RIH W/ 6 1/4" TAPERED MILL, 4 3/4" BUMPER SUB, 4 3/4"
JARS, X/O SUB, 122 JTS 2 7/8" TBG WORK THROUGH FISH
TOP @ 3844' CONT IN HOLE W/ 12 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG TO
4200', TAGGED UP, WORK TO GET LOOSE, ACTED LIKE PIECE
OF CSG,

POOH W/ 134 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D X/O SUB, JARS,
BUMPER SUB, TAPERED MILL.

( CONT TO DRAG TO 4000', STARTED PULLING FREE

P/U 6' SHOE W/ CUTRIGHT, TOP SUB, X/O SUB, 4 3/4" BUMPER
SUB, 4 3/4" JARS, X/O SUB, RIH W/ 122 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG,
WORK INTO FISH TOP @ 3844', CONT IN HOLE W/ 16 JTS TBG,
TAG @ 3958", R/U POWER SWIVEL BRK CIRC, START MILLING 5
MIN FALL FREE, CONT TO SWIVEL IN HOLE TO 4514',R/D
SWIVEL, RIH W/ 16 JTS TO 5004’

POOH W/ 64 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, EOT @ 3184".

TBG & CSG SHUT IN SDFN.

DIESEL USED = 130 GAL

TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, P/U CASING

0 SITP, 20# SICP, BLEED OFF CSG

EOT @ 3184', POOH W/ 100 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D X/O SUB,
JARS, BUMPER SUB, 6" SHOE

X/O TO CSG EQUIP, CHANGE PIPE RAMS, N/D WASH HEAD,
TALLY CSG.

P/U & RIH W/ BOWEN 8 3/8" OD PACKER TYPE EXTERNAL
CASING PATCH, 40 JTS 7" 29# P-110 LTC CSG, INSTALL 10'
MARKER JT, CONT IN HOLE W/ 53 JTS 7" 29# CSG, WORK
OVER STUB, SET 4K DOWN, P/U ON PATCH TO STRING
WEIGHT, SET SLIPS.

MIRU CASED HOLE SOLUTIONS, RIH W/ 6.03" GUAGE RING, RUN
THROUGH PATCH @ 3844', NO TAG,RIH THROUGH 2 CSG
COLLARS BELOW PATCH, POOH L/D GAUGE RING P/U 7"
WIRELINE SET RBP, RIH SET @ 3007', POOH R/D WIRELINE.
CSG &SURFACE SHUT IN, SDFN.

DIESEL USED = 120 GAL

TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, N/D & N/U BOPS

0 PSI SICP, 0 PSI SURFACE

R/D FLOOR, N/D 11" BOPS, CUT CSG, N/U TUBING HEAD, PSI
TEST TUBING HEAD TO 5K, 15 MIN 0 LOSS, N/U 5K BOPS, R/U
FLOOR & TBG EQUIP.
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Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
12:30 14:00 1.50 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 7"RET HEAD, 96 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, LATCH ON
TO RBP @ 3007', RELEASE RBP
13:00 15:00 2.00 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 96 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D RET HEAD & 7" RBP.
15:00 17:00 2.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 6" WASH OVER SHOE, 1 JT 5 1/2" WASH PIPE, TOP

SUB, X/O SUB, 4 3/4" BUMPER SUB, 4 3/4" JARS, X/O SUB, 148
JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, EOT @ 4825'
TBG & CSG SHUT IN, SDFN.

DIESEL USED = 80 GAL

8/8/2014  6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, POWER SWIVEL CONNECTIONS
O # SITP & SICP
7:30 9:00 1.50 WOR 39 P EOT @ 4825', CONT IN HOLE W/ 102 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, TAG
@ 7948’
9:00  10:00 1.00 WOR 40 P R/U POWER SWIVEL, BREAK CIRC REVERSE, START MILLING,

GET TO 8110', PLUGGED SHOE, UNABLE TO GET UNPLUGGED.
R/D POWER SWIVEL.

10:00 15:30 5.50 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 252 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, X/O SUB, JARS, BUMPER
SUB, X/O SUB, TOP SUB, 1 JT WASH PIPE, SHOE.
( EVRY COLLAR WAS HANGING UP UNTIL EOT WAS @ 3880')

15:30 16:30 1.00 WOR 42 N RIG WAS IDLING & SHUT OFF, MECHANIC FOUND ELECTRICAL
BREAKER HAD TRIPPED.
16:30 19:30 3.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 6" STRING MILL, X/O SUB, 4 3/4" BUMPER SUB, 4

3/4" JARS, X/O SUB, 123 JTS 2 7/8" TBG, TAG @ 3925', WORK
THROUGH TIGHT SPOT SEVERAL TIMES.
POOH W/ 4 JTS TO 3812', SHUT TBG & CSG IN, SDFN.

DIESEL USED = 120 GAL

8/9/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, TOOH W/ TBG
0 PSI SITP & SICP.
7:30 8:30 1.00 WOR 40 P EOT @ 3812' R/lU POWER SWIVEL CONT IN HOLE TO 4129'

DRESSING UP CSG.

DIDNT SEE ANYTHING W/ STRING MILL, STILL HANGING UP
EVRY 30' BELOW PATCH, ACTS LIKE TUBING COLLARS
CATCHING ALIP IN CSG.

8:30 9:30 1.00 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 130 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, L/D 6" STRING MILL.

9:30 17:00 7.50 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 6" ROCK BIT, BIT SUB, 222 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG TO
6992
BRK CIRC REV, CIRC WELL CLEAN,.CONT IN HOLE TAG @
7978'.

R/U POWER SWIVEL BREAK CIRC REV, C/O TO 8060' FALL
FREE, CIRC CLEAN,SWIVEL IN TO 8350' CIRC CLEN, RIH TO @
9111',W/ 289 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, RIG UP POWER SWIVEL,
ATTEMPT TO BREAK CIRC REV, BIT PLUGGED

17:00 20:00 3.00 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 40 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, EOT @ 7780
R/UTO CSG CIRC REV, CIRC TBG CLEAN.
TBG & CSG SHUT IN, SDFN

2% KCL PUMPED = 300 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 124 GAL

8/10/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, TIH W/ TBG
0 PSI SITP & SICP

November 12, 2014 at 4:05 pm 1 OienWeIIs
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Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
7:30 11:00 3.50 WOR 10 P EOT @ 7780', RIH W/ 20 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG TO 8474' BREK

CIRC REV W/ 2BBLS, CIRC CLEAN, RIH W/ 10 JTS 2 7/8" N-80
TBG TO 8793', BREAK CIRC REV, CIRC CLEAN, RIH W/ 10 JTS 2
7/8" N-80 TBG TO 9112', R/lU POWER SWIVEL, BREK CIRC REV,
CIRC CLEAN, SWIVEL IN W/ 2 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, TAG @
9170', C/O 14' FILL, TAG FISH TOP @ 9184'.SLMD

CIRC CLEAN. R/D POWER SWIVEL

11:00 16:00 5.00 WOR 39 P L/D 4 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, POOH W/ 288 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG,
L/D BIT & BIT SUB
16:00 18:00 2.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 6" WASH OVER SHOE, 1 JT 5 1/2" WASH PIPE, TOP

SUB, X/O SUB, 4 3/4" BUMPER SUB, 4 3/4" JARS, X/O SUB, 108
JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, EOT @ 3470'
TBG & CSG SHUT IN, SDFN.

2% KCL USED = 300 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 110 GAL

8/11/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, POWER SWIVEL CONNECTIONS
0 PSI SITP & SICP
7:30 9:30 2.00 WOR 39 P EOT @ 3470', RIH W/ 188 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG TO 9136', R/U
POWER SWIVEL, BRK CIRC REV W/ 2 BBLS.
9:30 16:00 6.50 WOR 40 P SWIVEL IN W/ 2 JTS, TAG FISH TOP @ 9184', START WASHING

OVER FISH, YAG TAC @ 9204', MILL OVER TAC, MAKE 14' TO
9218', RIG TREANSMISSION OVER HEATING.

( MECHANIC COMING TO REPAIR INA.M)

POOH W/ 5 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, EOT @ 8970

TBG & CSG SHUT IN SDFN

2% KCL LOST = 50 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 92 GAL

8/12/2014 7:00 23:00 16.00 WOR 18 P BASIC REPLACING TRANSMISSION ON RIG NO RIG ACTIVITY

8/14/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, POWER SWIVEL CONNECTIONS
0 PSI SITP & SICP

7:30 10:00 2.50 WOR 40 P EOT @ 8970', RIH W/ 5 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, TAG @ 9218', R/U

POWER SWIVEL, BRK CIRC REV W/ 2 BBLS, START WASHING
OVER TAC, MAKE 1' TO 9219', ACTS LIKE TOP SUB IS MILLING
ON FISH TOP, CIRCULATE CLEAN.

10:00 15:00 5.00 WOR 39 P L/D 3JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, POOH W/ 288 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG,
L/D X/O SUB, JARS, BUMPER SUB, TOP SUB 1 JT WASH OVER
PIPE, WASHOVER SHOE.
SHOE WAS WORN, NO MARKINGS ON TOP SUB, FISH APPEARS
TO MOVING DOWN HOLE.

15:00 18:00 3.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 5 3/4"™ OVERSHOT W/ 2 7/8" GRAPPLE, 4 3/4"
BUMPER SUB, 4 3/4" JARS, 4-4 3/4" DRILL COLLARS, 4 3/4"
INTENSIFIER, X/O SUB, 250
JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, EOT @ 8027,
TBG & CSG SHUT IN, SDFN.

2% KCL NOT RECOVERED = 300 BBLS
DIESEL USED =132 GAL

8/15/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATIO HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA
TOPIC; FISHING OPERATIONS
7:00 19:00 12.00 PRDHEQ 39 P FINISH TIH w FISH ASSEMBLY 37-JTS TAG AT 9204' ENGAUGE

FISH SOH w FISH PULLED 6-JTS FISH HANGIND UP UNABLE TO
COME UP R/U POWER SWIVEL WORK FISH IN THE HOLE TO
10968' WORK FISH FREE SOH w 144-JTS EOT 6141

8/16/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA
TOPIC; TRIPPING TUBING

November 12, 2014 at 4:05 pm 12 ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Nov. 12, 201%




Sundry Nunber: 57783 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000

CENTRAL DIVISION

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
7:00 11:30 4.50 WOR 39 P CONTINUE TOH w 150 TBG STAND BACK DRILL COLLARS L/D
BUMPER AND JARS L/D CUT TBG JOINT 7" TAC
11:30 18:00 6.50 WOR 39 P CHANGE HANDLING TOOL ATTEMPT TO PULL RODS FAILED P/U

BACK OFF TOOL BACK OFF RODS STRIP OUT L/D 32-3/4" 24-1"
PULL ROD 48-JTS OF 2 7/8" PERFORATED SUB PUMP PSN TBG
SUB AND BULL PLUG

18:00 19:00 1.00 WOR 39 P L/D 4-4 3/4" DRILL COLLARS SECURE WELL SDFN
8/17/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA

TOPIC; TRIPPING TUBING

7:00 12:00 5.00 WOR 39 P P/U 7" CSG SCRAPER 6" MILL TIH w 359-JTS OF 2 7/8" TBG TAG
AT 11353' TMD

12:00 14:00 2.00 WOR 06 P ESTABLISH CIRC w 198 BBLS CIRC WELL CLEAN w 580 BBLS
OF 2% KCL WATER

14:00 18:00 4.00 WOR 39 P R/U SCAN EQUIPMENT ATTEMPT TO SCAN TBG FAILED UNABLE

TO PULL FAST ENOUGH TBG COUPLINGS HANGING UP ON
PARTTED CSG R/D SCAN EQUIPMENT TOH L/D 111-JTS OF 2 7/8"
TBG SECURE WELL SDFN EOT 8037'

8/18/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA
TOPIC; LAYING DOWN TBG
7:00 13:00 6.00 WOR 39 P CONTINUE TOH L/D 253-JTS OF 2 7/8" TBG AND MOVE TBG TO
YARD SECURE WELL
13:00 16:00 3.00 WOR 16 P RIG DOWN FLOOR N/U HYDRILL R/U FLOOR TIE BACK RIG

TALLY TOP ROW OF 5" CSG RACK 8-4 3/4" DRILL COLLARS
20-JTS OF 3 1/2" IF DRILL PIPE SDFN

8/19/2014  6:00 7:00 1.00 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA
TOPIC; RUNNING LINER
7:00 20:00 13.00 WOR 39 P P/U 440 PKR P/U TIH 176-JTS OF 5" 18# CSG CHANGE

HANDLING TOOLS P/U XO LINER HANGER LINER PKR PBR
SETTING TOOL BUMPER SUB 8-4 3/4" DRILL COLLARS TIH w
10-JTS OF 3 1/2 IF DRILL PIPE SECURE WELL SDFN

8/20/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA
TOPIC; P/U DRILL PIPE
7:00 10:30 3.50 WOR 39 P CONTINUE P/U 63-JTS OF 3 1/2" IF DRILL PIPE
10:30 14:00 3.50 WOR 18 P SET THE BTM PKR (WEATHERFIRD 440) AT 9852"' w 25K

COMPRESSION DROP 1 3/8" BALL FILL DRILL PIPE 17 BBLS OF
2% KCL WATER SET HANGER AT 2585' w 1000 PSI PUMP BALL
AND SEAT OUT AT 1800 PSI PACK OFF TOP PKR TOP OF PBR AT
2568' FILL CSG AND TEST TO 500 PSI FOR 30 MIN TEST GOOD

14:00 18:00 4.00 WOR 24 P TOH L/D 73-JTS OF 3 1/2" IF DRILL PIPE L/D DRILL COLLARS L/D
SETTING TOOL R/D CASING EQUIPMENT SECURE WELL SDFN
8/21/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA
TOPIC; OVER HEAD LOADS
7:00 8:00 1.00 WOR 18 P N/D HYDRILL CHANGE HANDLING TOOLS FOR 2 3/8" TBG
8:00 12:30 4.50 WOR 57 P LAOD 5" 18# CSG LOAD 3 1/2" DRILL PIPE DRILL COLLARS AND

HANDLING TOOLS UNLOAD BHA 2 3/8" EUE 8RD TBG 2 7/8"
RTS-8 TBG RACK AND TALLY 2 3/8" TBG

12:30 12:30 0.00 WOR 39 P P/U BHA 2 3/8" BULL PLUG 2-JTS OF 2 3/8" EUE 8RD TBG 3 1/2"
PBGA w DIPE TUBE 2' X 2 3/8" EUE 8RD TBG SUB 2 3/8" PSN 4'
X 2 3/8" EUE 8RD 38-JTS OF 2 3/8" EUE 8RD TBG 5" TAC 2 3/8"
X 27/8" RTS-8 XO 223-JTS OF RTS-8 TBG SECURE WELL SDFN

EOT 8110'
8/22/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 WOR 28 P CREW TAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA
TOPIC; PICKING UP TUBING
7:00 11:30 4.50 WOR 39 P CONTINUE TIH w 57- 2 7/8" RTS-8 TAG SOLID BULL PLUG IS AT

9821' PBGA AT 9756' 5" TAC AT 8509' ATTEMPT TO WORK
THROUGH FAILED UNABLE TO GET DEEPER

November 12, 2014 at 4:05 pm 13 ienWeIIs
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Sundry Nunber: 57783 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000

CENTRAL DIVISION

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
11:30 15:00 3.50 WOR 39 P TOH w RTS-8 2 7/8" TBG CHANGE HANDLING TOOLS
CONTINUE w 38-JTS OF 2 3/8" TBG L/D BHA
15:00 20:00 5.00 WLWORK = 22 P HSM TOPIC; WIRELINE OPERATIONS...MIRU P/U 4" GAUGE RIG

TIH TAG AT 9853' WLMD TOH L/D GAUGE RING P/U 3 5/8"
IMPRESSION BLOCK TIH SET DOWN TOH L/D IMPRESSION
BLOCK RDWL SECURE WELL SDFN

8/23/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA
TOPIC; PICKING UP COLLARS
7:00 10:00 3.00 WOR 45 N ORDER OUT DRILL COLLARS AND TUBING PREPARE LOCATION
FOR PICK UP C/O ASSEMBLY
10:00 15:30 5.50 WOR 45 P TALLEY AND P/U 4 1/8" TAPERED MILL 2-3 1/8" DRILL COLLARS

TIH w 242 JTS OF RTS-8 TBG XO TO 2 7/8" EUE 8RD TBG
CONTINUE w 75- JTS OF 2 7/8" TBG TAG 9850 TMD

15:30 19:30 4.00 WOR 45 P R/U POWER SWIVEL ESTABLISH CIRC w 130 BBLS OF 2% KCL
WATER ENGAUGE OBSTRUCTION MILL THROUGH WORK MILL
THROUGH 5" LINER INTO 7" CSG PULL BACK INTO 5" LINER
CIRC WELL CLEAN SECURE WELL SDFN

8/24/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA
TOPIC; TRIPPING TUBING
7:00 12:00 5.00 WOR 39 P RUN MILL THOUGH BTM OF LINER R/D POWER SWIVELTOH w
75-2 7/8" 8RD TBG 242 JTS OF RTS-8 TBG L/D DRILL COLLARS
AND MILL
12:00 17:00 5.00 WOR 39 P P/U BHA 2 3/8" BULL PLUG 2-JTS OF 2 3/8" EUE 8RD TBG 3 1/2"

PBGA w DIPE TUBE 2' X 2 3/8" EUE 8RD TBG SUB 2 3/8" PSN 4'
X 2 3/8" EUE 8RD 38-JTS OF 2 3/8" EUE 8RD TBG 5" TAC 2 3/8"
X 2 7/8" RTS-8 XO 322-JTS OF RTS-8 TBG

17:00 19:00 2.00 WOR 16 P N/D BOPE SET 5" TAC AT 9803' w 25K TENSION N/U WELL

HEAD SECURE WELL SDFN
8/26/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, RIH W/ RODS

0 PSI SITP & SICP

7:30 8:30 1.00 WOR 18 P X/O TO ROD EQUIP

8:30 10:00 1.50 WOR 39 P M/U & RIH W/ 2 5/16" OS, 217 - 1" EL RODS, CHECKING EVERY
BREAK.

10:30 12:00 1.50 WOR 39 P POOH L/D 130-1" RECONDITIONED RODS, HANG BACK 87-1" EL
RODS

12:00 14:30 2.50 WOR 18 P HOT OILER FLUSH TBG W/ 40 BBLS 2% KCL @ 200 DEG, 1

DRUM PARFFIN SOLVENT, 30 BBLS 2% KCL @ 200 DEG, SPOT
10 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR.
PREP NEW RODS
14:30 18:00 3.50 WOR 39 P P/U & PRIME WALS 2" X 1 1/2" X 38' RHBC PUMP, RIH W/
10-1 1/2" K-BARS
40-3/4" EL RODS W/ SHG
188-3/4" EL RODS W/G ( TOP 113 NEW )
P/U POLISH ROD,EOR @ 6000', TBG & CSG SHUT IN. SDFN.

2% KCL PUMPED = 80 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 88GAL
PROPANE USED = 75 GAL
8/27/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM,

7:30 9:00 1.50 WOR 39 P EOR @ 6000', L/D POLISH ROD, RIH W/ 116-7/8" EL RODS ( TOP
4 NEW ), 83-1" EL RODS, SEAT, SPACE W/ 1" SUBS =
P/U POLISH ROD, HANG OFF.

9:00 10:00 1.00 WOR 18 P HOT OILER FILL TBG W/ 40 BBLS 2% KCL, PSI TEST TO 500# (
GOOD ), STROKE TEST TO 1000# ( GOOD ), PSI TEST CV TO
1000#, PUMP 10 BBLS 2% KCL @ 200 DEG ACROSS FLOWLINE.

November 12, 2014 at 4:05 pm 14 ienWeIIs
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Sundry Nunber: 57783 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000
CENTRAL DIVISION
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
10:00  12:00 2.00 RDMO 02 P RDMO, SLIDE ROTAFLEX IN, START UNIT, CHECK PUMP, NO TAG

GOOD PUMP ACTION, TWOTO.
CLEAN LOCATION, MOVE TO 2-19A1.

2% KCL PUMPED = 100 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 40 GAL
PROPANE USED = 100 GAL

November 12, 2014 at 4:05 pm

ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Nov. 12, 201%
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Sundry Nunber: 63857 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

FORM 9

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
14-20-H62-1704

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL
Oil Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
UTE TRIBAL 2-3472

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
43013311670000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER:

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:

1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext BLUEBELL
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1223 FSL 1957 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: SESW Section: 34 Township: 01.0N Range: 02.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

l:‘ ACIDIZE

I:‘ CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS

l:‘ ALTER CASING
J NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: D CHANGE TUBING

(] crance weLL sTaTus [ COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS

| SUBSEQUENT REPORT L] oeeren (] rraCTURE TREAT

Date of Work Completion:

O] operaTor crance CJ pLuc anp ABanDON
(] rrobuCTION START OR RESUME (] RecLamaTION OF weLL SITE

[ spuo reporT

Date of Spud: (] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION (] sipETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

O tusine Repar O vent orFLare

v

l:‘ SI TA STATUS EXTENSION

l:‘ OTHER

l:‘ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

WATER SHUTOFF

l:‘ WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION

|:| CASING REPAIR

I:‘ CHANGE WELL NAME

(]
(]
(]
(]
(]

I:‘ WATER DISPOSAL

CONVERT WELL TYPE

NEW CONSTRUCTION

PLUG BACK

RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

TEMPORARY ABANDON

|:| APD EXTENSION

OTHER: | |

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Perform cement squeeze to isolate water production. See attached for
details.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

Date: :

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Maria S. Gomez

713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
6/11/2015

RECEI VED: Jun.

11, 2015




Sundry Nunber: 63857 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000

EP .
6/1/2015

Ute Tribal 2-34Z2

Material Description Burst Col ID Drift Capacity TOC
(100%) | (100%) ID (bbl/it)

Surface 9-5/8" 40# S-95 & K-55 LT&C 3,520 2,020 | 8.921 | 8.765 0.0637 Surface
Casing @ 3,200'
Intermediate | 7" 29# & 32# @ 14,075 8,600 5,870 | 6.276; | 6.151; 0.0383 TOC @ 7,624
Casing (CBL '86)
Production 5" liner 18# AB FL4S @ 13,793- | 11,770 | 12,010 | 4.276 | 4.151 0.0178 TOL
Liner 15,990

Cement Squeeze Procedure

CURRENT STATUS:

The Ute Tribal 2-34Z2 produced at an average rate of 44 BOPD, 14 MCFD,138 BWPD prior to
going offline due to a casing leak in 2014. Although production was restored after a workover in
August, which included replacing 3,850’ of 7” 29# and installing 7,284’ scab liner across multiple
casing leaks, it produced significantly more water and less oil than before. Since 03/28/15, the well
has been producing only water and gas. It is believed that the bottom of the liner assembly is
leaking and a cement squeeze is needed in order to isolate the water production.

RECEI VED: Jun. 11, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 63857 APl Wl |

EP

company Nams: EFP Energy

Nunber :

Current WBD

EF

Pumping Schematic

43013311670000

6/1/2015

&

Last Updated: May 28 2015

well Name: Ute Tribal 2-3472

By: Tomowva

Flald, County, Stata: Altsmont - Blusbell

Duchesns,

Utah

TD: 16, 630"

Surface Lecatlon: £

BHL: Siraight Hole

Producing Zons{s): Wasaich

RKB:

Hotesa:

Spud: June 19, 1986

S22 Jis & 7/8" N-80 8rd Tubing

ROD DETAIL
1 172" x 40" Polished Rod
77 {19257 - 1" EL Rods
116 {2,9007 - 7/8" EL Rods
228 (57007 - 3/4" EL Rods
10 {2507 - 1 1/2" Sinker "iK" Bars
2T X1 12" M 38" Insert Pump

Oct'96- UW/LGR
9,931" to 11,314" (3 spf, 402 holes)
1,200 gals 15% HGCI

11,409° to 11,980° (3 spf, 213 holes)
6,500 gals 15% HCI

ﬂuuuﬁlu\l

Top packer @ 2,569

~

- Bottom packer @ 3,853
2 T8N 2 38" X0
E 5" HHH Tubing Anchor (@ 9,802"
— J8jts 2-3/8" N=-80 Tubing
— 4" Pup Joint
— L Seating Nipple @ 11,072'
2" Pup Joint

3 5/8" 40% M-55 @ 3, 200"

Augid
EXT CSG PATCH @ 850" &
NEW T~ 29% CSG to surf

5" 188 DUAL PACKER LINER ASSEM
FROM 2,569%9,853"

SMALLEST I.D = 4.276"

TOC @ 7,624 (CBL "86)

3-1/2" x 37" PBGA Shell

2 jts Z-3/8" N=-80 Mud Anchor
Solid Plug

EQT@ 11,7714°

7" CIBP 11,330" WLD
7" CIBP 11,980 WLD

TOL @ 13,841"

. TU2GE L F2EE 14,075
FISH TOP & 14075

16'-2 7/8" N-BO TBG

TRICO CSG FB

6 JTS 2 78" MN-80 TBG

5" REMATIC PKR

Scab Liner

5" FAB @ 15,061

5" 18% @ 15,9%0"MD
Drift ID 4.151™

RECEI VED: Jun. 11, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 63857 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000

EP ENERGY#

Proposed WBD

EP ENERGY4

Proposed SGZ Pumping Schematic

company Name: EP Energy Last Updated: June 1, 2015
wall Name: Ufe Tribal 2-3472 By: Tomowva
Flald, Counfy, Stata: Affamont - Bluebell,  Duchesne,  Utah TD: {6 630"
Surface Location: # BHL: Straight Hole
Producing Zons(s): Wasalch RHE:
Hiofes: spud: June 13, 1986
322 s 2 7/8" BTS-8 Tubing —3-.|

E E Top packer @ 2,569"

9-5/8" 40% 5-95 & M-55 LTE&C [@ 3200

ROD DETAIL
1 1/2™ x 40" Polished Rod
111 {27757 - 1" EL Rods
‘bottom 40 w' 4 gpr
117 {2,925 - 7/8" EL Rods w/' 4gpr
203 {5,0757 - 3/4" EL Rods w' 4gpr
3 (225 - 1 1/2" Sinker "K" Bars
2" X 1 1/2" X 38" Insert Pump

Aug'ld
EXT C5G PATCH @ 3850" &
NEW T" 29% CSG to surf
5" 182 DUAL PACKER LINER ASSEM
FROM 2,569%-9,853"
EMALLEETID =4 276"
TOC @ 7.624° (CBL "B5)

Proposed cement sgueeze-Jun'ls
CBP @ 9,800"; perf @ 9,750
CICR @ 9,700 & sqz 360+sx Class G cmt

*may pump extra cement based on inj rafe

Bottom packer @ 9,853
*Tight spot @ Bm of iner. RIH w tapered mill fo dress
2 T/B"X 2 3/8" X0

5% HHH Tubing Anchor @ %,800°
28jts 2-3/8" N-80 Tubing

Oct96- UW/LGR 4 Pup Jaoint
9,931 to 11,314" (3 spf, 402 holes) —< Seating Nipple @ 11,000°
1,200 gals 15%: HCI 2" Pup Joint

3-1/2" x 31" PBGA Shell

2 jts 2-3/8" N-8B0 Mud Anchor
Solid Plug

EQT @ 11,700"

T CIBP 11,330"WLD

7" CIBP 11,980 WLD

11,409° to 11,980 (3 spf, 213 holes)
6,500 gals 15% HCI

TOL @ 13 841"

TT 258 & 2@ 14,075
FISH TOP @ 14075'

16'-2 7/8" N-BO TBG

TRICO CSG FB

6 JTS 2 7iB" N-BO TBG

5" REMATIC PKR

— Scab Liner
[ —
— —
—* 5" FAB @ 15.081
E
—
T
—_— ——
— —
5" 18% @ 15,990"MD
Drift ID 4. 1517

RECEI VED: Jun. 11, 2015



Sundry Nunber :

EP ENI

Company:EP Energy

63857 API

Vel |

Well:Ute Tribal 2-3472

Diisk file:Lte Trbal 2-3422-1.5in-11000f-4. 35PM-6-1-3.rs

Comment:

Nurmber: 43013311670000
6/1/2015
RodStar
RODSTAR 3.6.1
& Theta Oilfeld Services. Inc. (gotheta.com) Page 2 of 5
User-Tomova
Date:6/1/2015

INPUT DATA CALCULATED RESULTS (TOTAL SCORE: 91% Grade: A-)
Strokes per minute: 473 Fluid lawvel Production rate (bfpd): 288 Peak pol. pod load (lbs): 34172
Run time (hrs/day):  24.0 (ft from surface): 11000 Zil production (BOPD): G5 Min. pol. rod load (lbs): 16121
Tubing pres. {psik: 50 (ft ower pump): o Strokes per minute: 4.3 MPRL/PPRL- 047
Casing pres. (psi) 50 Stuf. Box Fr. (lbs) 100 53"51?"" _EFf_ (Motor->Pump) 469% Uit struct. loading: BR%
Pol. rod. diam. 1.5" F'er_rnlﬁﬁlble Load Hp: 128.9 ERHP | ELHE: 0.7
Fluid load on oume (lbsh: 8213
Fluid Properties Motor & Power Meter Palished rod HP: 353 Bucyant rod weight (lbs): 21213
NiMo: 185 , FolSKr 212
Water cut TEY% Power meter Detent - . .
WWater sp. gravity: 1.01 Elect cost  5.06/KWH Required prime mover size Balanced (Min
il AP gravity: B Type: MEMA D {zpeed var. not included) Tong)
Fluid sp. gravity: 0.2758 NEMA O mator: 50 HP
Single/double cyl. engine: 50 HP
Multicylinder Engine: 50 HP
Pumping UnitRotaflex (1100) Torgue analysis and electncity Balanced (Min
consumptian Torg)
APl Size: R-320-300-306 (Unit ID: R4)
Crank hole number: &1 joutof 1) Peak g'box torg (M in-lbs): 151
Calculated stroke length (in): s7 Gearbox loading: 47 ¥%
Crank rotation with well to nght: Cow Cyclic load factor: 1.092
Maix. cb weight (M lbs): Unknown Counterbalance weight(M Ibs): 2515
Daily Electr.Use (KwhDay): 779
Monthly Electric Bill: $1425
Electr.cost per bbl fluid: $0.174
Electr.cost per bbl oik $0.724
Tubing And Pump Information
Tubing, Purnp And Plunger Calculations
Tubing 0.0 (in}: 2875 Upstr. rod-thg fr. coeff. 0.500
Tubng LD. (im): 2441 Dinstr. rod-thg fr. coeff.- 0.500 Tulbang stretch (in): 21
Prod. loss due to tubing stretch (bipd): 21
Pump depth (ftx 11000 Tub.anch.depth {ft): 9300 Gross pump stroke (in): 2825
Pump conditions:  Full Pump load adj. {lbs): 0.0 Pump spacing {in. from botiom): 504
Pump type: Inzert Pump vol. efficiency: B5% Minimum purmnp length (ft) 380
Plunger size {in): 15 Pump friction (lbs): 2000 Recommendad plunger length (f): 6.0
Reod stning design (rod tapers calculated) Rod stning stress analysis (service factor: 0L.8)
Diameter Length Min. Tensile Stress Top Masamum | Top Minmum Bot. Minimum Stress Cale.
{in} Rod Grade (f) Strength (psi) Load % Saress (psi) Stress (psi) Stress (psi) Mathod
+1 WFT EL 2773 WA B4.5% 43382 20634 13160 WFTEL
0875 WFT EL 2525 MiA B48% 41948 13592 10039 WFT EL
073 WFT EL 5073 MiA B4E6% 40319 10343 873 WFT EL
1.3 K {API. 58] 225 83000 B3.0°% 3632 -2210 -113 APl MG
+requires simhole couplings. i siress cakulabons based on elevator neck of 7/8 (for 1.25 sinker bars) or 1 (for other sinker bars].
NOTE: Display botom shesc = do not Inchude buoyancy effects (lop r and maor stre always nclude bucyancyl.
Dynamometer Cards Gasrbon Torgue Flots
ey Sh050 ambar -y
el i)
30 3E000
=) N = .
S000 i o G
Fa F000 H Ir\\-"\. ' |'.-\-""| ™,
B B0 | 0 1 " - |'I II'-./_J \'uvll'- I " 'I II"./J \U-\vﬂ"
Em.uo {\——J & 31080 = . / W \ \
R 1] ; I
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Siu 15060 = w0
T 12000 # . I
st ] " 000
3000 .'I | I'nl 000 - Gaartor Raleg
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Sundry Nunber: 63857 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000

EP .
6/1/2015

Cement Squeeze Procedure

1. Notify:
- BLM and UDOGM of cement squeeze operations at least 24 hours prior to start of well
work (See Contact List).
- Notify the Fort Duchesne Office of the BIA, 435-722-4320, at least 48 hours prior to
initiating the plugging procedure
- Notify the Ute Indian Tribe Energy & Minerals Office, Kermit Wopsock, 435-725-4999 or
435-725-4950,at least 48 hours prior to initiating the plugging procedure.

2. MIRU workover rig. RU Hot Oil Unit and pump hot FSW down casing to heat up tubing.
Unseat pump and flush tubing & rods with hot water. POOH w/rods & pump.

3. Send pump in for inspection & rebuild. ND tree and NU and test BOP’s to 5,000# for 10
minutes. Have test recorded and charted to be signed and dated by well site supervisor.
Record BOP serial number.

4. Release tubing anchor at ~ 9,802’ and POOH scanning 2 7/8” BTS-8 tubing for wear. Lay out
all bad joints. Check for NORM. If no NORM is found, note it in the daily report; If NORM is
found in the tubing; Follow El Paso procedures and chain of custody paperwork for handling,
wrapping and transporting NORM tubing to a proper cleaning or disposal site.

5. MIRU E-line. Test lubricator. RIH w/ GR (for 5” 18# casing) to ~9,850'. If tag higher, continue
with procedure, otherwise skip to step 7.

6. RD E-line. PU 4-1/8" RB, 5” 18# casing scraper on 2 7/8” BTS-8 tubing. Hydro test tubing to
7,000# while RIH. Work down to EOL @ ~9,853..

7. PU & MU a 5"- (18#) CBP on E-line and set CBP @ £9,800’.POOH. Dump bail 20’ cmt on top.
POOH. Test casing to 1,000psi, if test fails, contact Houston.

8. PU & MU a perforation assembly; RIH to £9,750’; Pressure up to 500psig on casing and
perforate casing at £9,750’; POOH.

9. Establish injection rate from surface. Report injection rate to Houston and correct cement
volumes if needed.

10.PU & MU a 5”- (18#) CICR on E-line and set CICR @ +9,700’. POOH. EDMO E-Line.

11.RIH w/ 2 7/8” BTS-8 tubing and stinger and sting into retainer @ 9,700'.

12.Mix and circulate In-Out cement plug with £360 sacks (£66bbls) (or more depending on
injection test) of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement. Pump +64bbls below the cement retainer.
Sting out of the cement retainer; Lay in the remaining balanced cement plug, (x2bbls)(100’) on
top of the cement retainer.

13.PU above cement and Reverse circulate the hole clean; Monitor surface samples of cement to
determine when the cement has set up; WOC. Wait at least 1 full day.

14.POOH w/ tubing.

15.PU 4-1/8” bit and 2 7/8” BTS-8 tubing and drill out cement and CICR to ~9,780’ (TOC on top of
CBP @ 9,800’). Pressure test casing to 1,000psi. If casing tests good, drill out cement and
CBP @ 9,800, otherwise contact Houston.

16.MIRU E-line. Test lubricator. Tag TD. PU & MU CBL & log from top perf @ 9,931’ to surface.
POOH. RDMO E-line

17.Send bond log to Houston and evaluate with engineer. If bond is found to be sufficient,
proceed with procedure, otherwise discuss re-squeeze procedure with Houston.

18.PU pumping BHA (2-3/8” bull plug, 2 jt 2-3/8" mud anchor, 3-1/2” PBGA w/ dip tube, 2’ x 2 3/8”
tubing sub, 2-3/8” PSN, 4’ 2-3/8” tubing sub, 38 jts 2-3/8” L-80 8rd tubing, 5” tubing anchor, 2-

5

RECEI VED: Jun. 11, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 63857 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000

EP =
6/1/2015

7/8” BTS-8 x 2-3/8” 8rd crossover & 322 jts 2-7/8" L-80 BTS-8 tubing. Hydro test production
tubing to 7,000# while RIH. Space out, set TA with 25,000 Ibs tension at £9,800" and land
tubing. ND BOP and NU pumping tee.

19.RIH with 2" x 1 1/2” x 38’ Insert Pump, 9 — 1.5” Sinker K Bars; 203 — %" EL Rods w/ 4gpr, 117
— 7/8" EL Rods w/ 4gpr, 111 — 1” EL Rods (bottom 40 w/ 4gpr) & 1-1/2” x 40’ Polished Rod as
per Rod Star Design, attached hereto. RD&MO service rig. PWOP and make sure rods are
not tagging bottom. Clean location.

RECEI VED: Jun. 11, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 65453 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 14.20.H62-1704 '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well UTE TRIBAL 2-34Z2
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P. 43013311670000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext BLUEBELL
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1223 FSL 1957 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: SESW Section: 34 Township: 01.0N Range: 02.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
1/ ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
] NOTICE OF INTENT [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
1/ SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT J D |:|
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER: I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
e . 0
EP performed cement squeeze and acidized with 15,000 gal 15% HCL. Accepted by the

See attached for details. Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
August 19, 2015

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 8/13/2015

RECEI VED: Aug. 13, 2015




Sundry Nunber: 65453 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000

CENTRAL DIVISION

ALTAMONT FIELD
UTE TRIBAL 2-3422
UTE TRIBAL 2-34Z2
WORKOVER LAND

Operation Summary Report

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s)
does (do) not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the
possession or use of the report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this
report or any part thereof, is solely at the user’s own risk.

RECEI VED: Aug. 13, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 65453 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000

CENTRAL DIVISION
1 General
1.1 Customer Information
Company CENTRAL DIVISION
Representative
Address
1.2 Well Information
Well UTE TRIBAL 2-34Z2
Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site UTE TRIBAL 2-34Z2
Rig Name/No. Event WORKOVER LAND
Start date 6/29/2015 End date
Spud Date/Time 6/19/1986 uwi 034-001-N 002-W 30
Active datum KB @5,922.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)
Afe 164982/54285 / UTE TRIBAL 2-3472
No./Description
2 Summary
21 Operation Summary
Date Time Duratio Phase |Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
6/27/2015 12:00 14:00 2.00 MIRU 01 P MOVE FROM 3-10B4, SLIDE ROTAFLEX BACK, SPOT & RIG UP
RIG.
HOT OILER PUMP 100 BBLS 2% KCL @ 200 DEG DOWN CSG.
14:00 15:00 1.00 WOR 39 P L/D POLISH ROD, P/U 1" WORK ROD, WORK PUMP OFF SEAT,

L/D 1" WORK ROD, 1" PONY RODS-1-2', 2-4', 1-8', PULL UP 3-1"
EL RODS, CLOSE RATIGAN.

15:00 16:00 1.00 WOR 18 P HOT OILER FLUSH TBG W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL @ 200 DEG

16:00 17:30 1.50 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 77-1" EL RODS, EOR @ 9100'".
P/U POLISH ROD SECURE WELL, TBG SHUT IN, CSG TO SALES,
SDFN.

2% KCL PUMPED = 100 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 44 GAL
PROPANE USED = 100 GAL

6/30/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, POOH W/ RODS
50# SITP & FCP, BLEED OFF
7:30 12:30 5.00 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 116-7/8" EL RODS ( L/D 40 W/ BUSTED OR WORN
GUDES))

228- 3/4" EL RODS
L/D 10-1 1/2" K-BARS & PUMP
FLUSHING AS NEEDED, WELL CIRCULATING
(NOTE- HAD TO SLOW, BROKEN RODS GUIDES HANGING UP )
12:30 13:30 1.00 WOR 16 P X/O TO TBG EQUIP, TIE BACK SINGLE LINE, N/D WH, UNLAND
TBG, REMOVE B- FLANGE, INSTALL 6' - 2 2/78' N-80 TBG SUB,
STRIP ON & N/U BOPS, R/U FLOOR, RELEASE TAC., L/D TBG
SUBS.
13:30 19:00 5.50 WOR 39 P MIRU DELSCO TBG SCANNERS, SCAN OOH W/ 170 JTS 2 7/8"
BTS-8 TBG, EOT @ 5930', TBG SHUT IN, CSG TO SALES, SDFN.

2% KCL PUMPED = 200 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 92 GAL
PROPANE USED = 200 GAL
711712015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, SCANNING TUBING
50# SITP & FCP, BLEED OFF

August 11, 2015 at 7:41 am 1 ienWeIIs
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Sundry Nunber :

65453 API

Vel |

Nunber :

43013311670000

CENTRAL DIVISION

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date

Time
Start-End

Duratio
n
(hr)

Phase

Activit | Sub
y

OP
Code

MD from
(ft)

Operation

7/2/2015

7/3/2015

10:00

14:30

17:00

7:30 10:00

14:30

17:00

20:30

6:00 7:30

7:30 18:30

18:30 19:30

6:00 7:30

7:30 9:00

2.50

4.50

2.50

3.50

1.50

11.00

1.00

1.50

1.50

WOR

WLWORK

WBP

WLWORK

WOR

WOR

WOR

WOR

WBP

39

27

36

21

28

39

35

28

05

EOT @ 5930' SCAN OOH W/ 152 JTS 2 7/8" BTS-8 TBG, 2 7/8"
BTS X 2 3/8" EUE X/O SUB, 5" TAC, L/D 38 JTS 2 3/8" N-80 TBG,
R/D SCANNERS, L/D 4'-2 3/8" N-80 TBG SUB, 2 3/8" SEAT
NIPPLE, 2'-2 3/8" N-80 TBG SUB, 3 1/2" PBGA W/ DIP TUBE, 2
JTS 2 3/8" N-80 TBG ( MUD JTS ) 2 3/8" BULL PLUG.

TOTAL JTS SCANNED

27/8"BTS-8-322 JTS ALL YELLOW BAND

2 3/8" N-80 - 38 SCANNED ALL YELLOW

MIRU THE PERFORATORS, RIH W/ 4 00" GAUGE RING, TO 9842
WLD, TAGGED UP, UNABLE TO WORK DEEPER, POOH, L/D GR
& JB, M/U & RIH W/ 5" CBP, SET @ 9790' WLD, POOH, L/D
SETTING TOOL, M/U & RIH W/ CMT BAILER, TAG PLUG @ 9790’
WLD, DUMP 20' CMT, POOH.L/D BAILER

CHECK SURFACE CSG, 50# SHUT IN PSI, BLEED OFF

R/U HOT OILER TO CSG, FILL W/ 100 BBLS 2% KCL, PSI TEST
TO 1000#, 0 LOSS IN 15 MIN,

M/U & RIH W/ 2 3/4" PERF GUN, LOADED 3 SPF, PERF 5" CSG
LINER, FROM 9743'-9745' W/ 6 SHOTS, HELD 500 PSI ON CSG,
WENT ON VACUUM AFTER PERFORATING, POOH, L/D PERF
GUN, HOT OILER FILL CSG W/ 20 BBLS 2% KCL, ESTABLISH INJ
RATE OF 3 BBLS MIN @ 500 PSI, M/U & RIH W/ 5" CICR SET @
9700', POOH L/D SETTING TOOL. R/D WIRELINE

R/U RIG PUMP TO CSG, FILL W/ 10 BBLS PSI TEST CICR TO
500#, 0 LOSS 15 MIN

SECURE WELL, CSG TO SALES, SDFN.

2% KCL PUMPED = 150 BBLS

DIESEL USED = 116 GAL

PROPANE USED = 100 GAL

TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, HYDROTESTING TUBING

0 PSI SICP

P/U & RIH W/ WEATHERFORD CICR STINGER, 2 3/8" SEAT NIPPLE
W/ SV IN PLACE, 2 JTS 2 7/8" BTS TBG, PSI TEST TO 8500%#,
RETRIEVE SV, R/U HYDROTESTER, RIH HYDROTESTING TO
8500 PSI W/ 319JTS 2 7/8" BTS TBG, X/O SUB, SPACE W/ 6'-10'
,27/8"N-80 SUBS, HYDROTEST SUBS, R/D HYDROTESTER,

FLUSHED W/ HOT OILER SEVERAL TIMES, VERY WAXY
STING INTO CICR @ 9700', PUMP 20 BBLS @ 4 BBLS MIN @
800#,.

PSI TEST CSG TO 1000#, 0 LOSS 15 MIN.

TBG SHUT IN, CSG TO SALES, SDFN.

2% KCL PUMPED = 200 BBLS

DIESEL USED = 100 GAL

PROPANE USED = 200 GAL

TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, PUMPING CEMENT

TBG ON SLIGHT VACUUM, 0 PIS SICP.

MIRU PRO PETRO CEMENT PUMP TRUCKS, HSM, PSI TEST
SURFACE LINES TO 4000#

August 11, 2015 at 7:41 am

ienWeIIs
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Sundry Nunber: 65453 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000

CENTRAL DIVISION

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
9:00 10:30 1.50 WBP 05 P FILL TBG W/ 15 BBLS FRESH, EST INJ RATE OF 3 BBLS MIN @

500 PSI, PUMP 400 SXS GLASS G NEAT CMT @ 15.8 LBS, 1.15
YLD INTO PERFS @ 9743'-9745', FLUSH W/ 56 BBLS FRESH
WATER.

W/ 64 BBLS CMT PUMPED GOT RETURNS IN SURFACE CSG,

STAGED IN W/ LAST 4 BBLS CMT.
10:30 11:00 0.50 WBP 06 P STING OUT OF RETAINER W/ 500 PSI, L/D 6' & 10" 2 7/8" N-80
TBG SUBS, POOH W/ 4 JTS 2 7/8" BTS TBG, REV CIRC W/ 90
BBLS FRESH, RETURNED 2 BBLS CMT.
11:00 15:00 4.00 WOR 39 P POOH W/ 315 JTS 2 7/8" BTS TBG, X/O SUB, L/D STINGER.
15:00 16:30 1.50 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 4 1/8" 3 BLADE MILL, X/O SUB, 4-2 7/8" DRILL
COLLARS, X/O SUB, X/O SUB, 76 JTS 2 7/8" BTS TBG.
EOT @ 2450', TBG & CSG SHUT IN, SDFN.

DIESEL USED = 76 GAL

7/7/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON RIH W/ TUBING.
FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 9:30 2.00 WOR 39 P CONTINUED RIH W/ 110 -JTS BTS-8 2 7/8, TAGGED @ 9605'. RU
POWER SWIVEL.
9:30 19:30 10.00 WOR 10 P PUMPED 15 BBLS ESTABLISHED REVERSE CIRCULATION.

DRILLED CEM FROM 9605' TO CICR @ 9700' STARTED DRILLING
CICR @ 12:00. DRILLED ON CICR. UNTIL 7:00. DID NOT MAKE IT
THRU. CIRCULATE TBG CLEAN.

19:30 20:00 0.50 WOR 39 P HUNG POWER SWIVEL IN DERRICK. TOOH W/ 9-JTS 2 7/8
BTS-8, EOT @ 9416. CLOSED IN WELL CLOSED TIW VALVE AND
INSTALLED NIGHT CAPS. CLOSED AND LOCKED PIPE RAMS.
LEFT CSG OPEN TO TREATER. SDFN.

7/8/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON RU POWER SWIVEL
FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 8:00 0.50 WOR 39 P 0 CSIP, 0 TSIP. RIH W/ 9-JTS 2 7/8 BTS-8 TBG. RU POWER
SWIVEL.
8:00 12:30 4.50 WOR 10 P PUMPED 2 BBLS ESTABLISHED REVERSE CIRCULATION.

FINISHED DRILLING OUT CICR @ 9700'. CONTINUED DRILLING
CEM FELL THRU @ 9763'. TAGGED CEM ON TOP OF CBP @
9780'. CIRCULATE TBG CLEAN.

12:30 13:30 1.00 WOR 06 P ISOLATE WELL AND PRESSURE TEST CSG 3 TIMES @ 1000 PSI.
LOST 150 PSI IN 15 MINS.
13:30 20:00 6.50 WOR 10 P DRILLED CEM FROM 9780 TO CBP @ 9790' DRILLED OUT CBP.

CIRCULATE TBG CLEAN. RIH TAGGED REMAINS OF CBP @
9844'. DRILLED UP REMAINS CBP AND CEM TO 9874'. MILL WAS
PARTIALLY PLUG. HAD TO CIRCULATED CONVENTIONAL.
CIRCULATED WELL CLEAN W/ 300 BBLS.

20:00 21:00 1.00 WOR 39 P RACKED OUT POWER SWIVEL. LD 10 JTS 2 7/8 TBG. EOT @
9540'. CLOSED IN WELL CLOSED TIW VALVE AND INSTALLED
NIGHT CAP. CLOSED AND LOCKED PIPE RAMS. CLOSED CSG
VALVES AND INSTALLED NIGHT CAPS.

7/9/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON PICKING UP TBG.
FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 8:00 0.50 WOR 39 P 0 TSIP. 0 CSIP. PU 10-JTS 2 7/8 BTS-8 TBG TAGGED 6' OUT JT

#321 9874'. RU POWER SWIVEL.

August 11, 2015 at 7:41 am 3 ienWeIIs
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Sundry Nunber: 65453 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000

CENTRAL DIVISION

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
8:00 9:30 1.50 WOR 10 P UNABLE TO REVERSE CIRCULATE @ 1000 PSI. CIRCULATE

CONVENTIONAL @ 2000 PSI PUMPING 2 BPM RETURNING 2 BPM
MILL STILL PARTAILLY PLUGGED. DRILLED CEM FROM 9874 TO
9880'. TBG TORQUED UP LOST CIRCULATION. WORKED TBG
FREE. WAS ABLE TO CIRCULATE BOTH WAYS @ 3 BPM @ 800
PSI. TRIED TO DRILL CEM. TBG PLUGGED OFF. UNABLE TO
CIRCULATE. RD POWER SWIVEL.

9:30 13:00 3.50 WOR 39 P TOOH W/ 321-JTS 2 7/8 BTS-8 TBG. X-OVER, 4-2 7/8 DRILL
COLLARS, BIT SUB AND 4 1/8 MILL. MILL WAS PLUGGED AND
BTM COLLAR.

13:00 14:30 1.50 WOR 39 P RIH W/ 4 1/8 BIT, BIT SUB, 3-2 7/8 DRILL COLLARS, X-OVER,

AND 83-JTS 2 7/8 BTS-8 TBG. OPERATOR STACKED OUT ON
LINER TOP AT HIGH RAT OF SPPEED. DECIDE TO TOOH AND
LOOK AT BIT.

14:30  17:30 3.00 WOR 54 N TOOH TO CHECK BIT, CONE WAS BROKE OFF BIT. WAIT ON
MILL. RIH W/ 4 1/8 INSERT MILL, BIT SUB, 3 2 7/8 DRILL
COLLARS. X-OVER AND 83 JTS 2 7/8 BTS-8 TBG. TO LINER TOP
@ 2569'

17:30  18:30 1.00 WOR 39 P CONTINUED RIH W/ 90-JTS 2 7/8 BTS-8 TBG. EOT @ 5360".
CLOSED IN WELL CLOSED TIW VALVE AND INSTALLED NIGHT
CAP. CLOSED AND LOCKED PIPE RAMS. CLOSED CSG VALVES
AND INSTALLED NIGHT CAPS. SDFN.

7/10/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TUBING.
FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 9:00 1.50 WOR 39 P O0TSIP, OCSIP. CONTINUED RIH W/ 146-JTS 2 7/8 BTS-8 TBG,

X-OVER AND 3-JTS 2 7/8 L-80 EUE TBG. TAGGED @ 9880’ (6'
OUT JT #322). RU POWER SWIVEL.

9:00 19:00 10.00 WOR 10 P ESTABLISHED REVERSE CIRCULATION PUMPING 2.5 BPM @ 700
PSI AND RETURNING 2.5 BPM. DRILLED CONE AND CEMENT
FROM 9880' TO 10013' (TTL 326-JTS 2 7/8). CIRCULATE TBG
CLEAN W/ 90 BBLS.

19:00 20:00 1.00 WOR 39 P RD POWER SWIVEL. TOOH W/ 7-JTS 2 7/8 L-80 EUE TBG
X-OVER AND 18-JTS 2 7/8 BTS-8 TBG. EOT @ 9250'. CLOSED IN
WELL CLOSED TIW VALVE AND INSTALLED NIGHT CAP.
CLOSED AND LOCKED PIPE RAMS. CLOSED CSG VALVES AND
INSTALLED NIGHT CAPS. SDFN.

7/11/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TUBING.
FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 12:00 4.50 WOR 18 P 0 TSIP. 0CSIP. TOOH W/ 301-JTS 2 7/8 BTS-8 TBG, X-OVER,3-2

7/8 COLLARS, BIT SUB AND 4 1/8 INSERT MILL. RIH W/ 4 1/8
ROCK BIT, BIT SUB AND 3-2 7/8 COLLARS.X-OVER, 321-JTS 2
7/8 BTS-8 TBG, X-OVER AND 5-JTS 2 7/8 L-80 EUE TBG.
TAGGED @ 10013'.

12:00 18:45 6.75 WOR 10 P ESTABLISHED REVERSE CIRCULATION PUMPING 2.5 BPM @ 800
PSI AND RETURNING 2.5 BPM.DRILLED CEM FROM 10013' TO
10102'. CEM KEPT FALLING IN ON TOP OF BIT HAD TO KEEP
WORKING TUBING FREE. CIRCULATE TBG CLEAN. RD POWER
SWIVEL.

18:45 19:30 0.75 WOR 39 P TOOH W/ 8-JTS 2 7/8 L-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER AND 12-JTS 2 7/8
BTS-8 TBG, EOT @ 9490'.CLOSED IN WELL CLOSED TIW VALVE
AND INSTALLED NIGHT CAP. CLOSED AND LOCKED PIPE RAMS.
CLOSED CSG VALVES AND INSTALLED NIGHT CAPS. SDFN.

7/12/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON POWER SWIVEL.
FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 8:00 0.50 WOR 39 P RIH W/ 12-JTS BTS-8 2 7/8 TBG, X-OVER AND 8-JTS 2 7/8 L-80

EUE TBG. TAGGED @ 10102". 5' OUT JT #329.
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Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
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8:00 18:30 10.50 WOR 10 P RU POWER SWIVEL. ESTABLISHED CONVENTIONAL

CIRCULATION. PUMPING 3.5 BPM @ 1200 PSI. RETURNING 3.5
BPM. DRILLED CEM FROM 10102' TO 10303'. WHILE
CIRCULATING CLEAN. CEMENT OFF WALLS OF 7" CSG FALLING
IN ON BIT, SWIVELED THREE JTS 2 7/8 OUT. STILL STICKY.
SWIVELED 11-JTS 2 7/8 OUT EOT @ 9850' CIRCULATE WELL
CLEAN. TOOH W/ 40-JTS 2 7/8 TBG. EOT @ 9235'. CLOSED IN
WELL CLOSED TIW VALVE AND INSTALLED NIGHT CAP.
CLOSED AND LOCKED PIPE RAMS. CLOSED CSG VALVES AND
INSTALLED NIGHT CAPS. SDFN.

7/13/2015 6:00 6:00 24.00 WOR 18 P NO ACTIVITY
7/14/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TUBING .
FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 10:30 3.00 WOR 39 P 0 TSIP, 0 CSIP. OPENED WELL TOOH W/ 281-JTS 2 7/8 BTS-8
TBG, X-OVER, 3-2 7/8 DRILL COLLARS, BIT SUB AND BIT.
10:30 13:30 3.00 WLWORK 42 P WAIT FOR WIRELINE TO RUN CBL.
13:30 18:00 4.50 WLWORK 22 P RU WIRELINE RIH ,RAN CBL FROM. 9853’ TO 6000' TOP CEM

7310'. CORRELATED TO TOP OF 5" SCAB LINER @ 2569'. RD
WIRELINE CLOSED IN WELL. CLOSED AND LOCKED BLIND
RAMS. CLOSED CSG VALVES AND INSTALLED NIGHT CAPS.

SDFN.
7/15/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TUBING.
FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 10:00 2.50 WOR 39 P 0 TSIP, 0 CSIP. OPENED WELL RIH W/ BIT , UNDER REAMER, BIT

SUBS, 3-2 7/8 DRILL COLLARS, X-OVERS, 321-JTS 2 7/8 BTS-8
TBG EOT @ 9853'. PU X-OVER AND 1-JT 2 7/8 L-80 EUE TBG
RU POWER SWIVEL..

10:00 18:00 8.00 WOR 10 P ESTABLISHED CONVENTIONAL CIRCULATION. PUMPING 3 BPM
AND RETURNING 3 BPM. REAMED OUT 7" CSG FROM 9860' TO
10111". CIRCULATE CSG CLEAN W/ 315 BBLS 2% KCL.

18:00 19:00 1.00 WOR 39 P RD POWER SWIVEL. TOOH W/ 9-JTS 2 7/8 L-80 EUE TBG,
X-OVER AND 12-JTS 2 7/8 BTS-8 TBG. EOT @ 9549'. CLOSED IN
WELL CLOSED TIW VALVE AND INSTALLED NIGHT CAP.
CLOSED AND LOCKED PIPE RAMS. CLOSED CSG VALVES AND
INSTALLED NIGHT CAPS. SDFN.

7/16/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TUBING.
FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 8:30 1.00 WOR 39 P RIH W/ 12-JTS 2 7/8 BTS-8 TBG, X-OVER AND 8-JTS 2 7/8 L-80

EUE TBG (TTL 329-JTS TAGGED @ 10111"). RU POWER SWIVEL
ESTABLISH CONVENTIONAL CIRCULATION PUMPING 3 BPM @
1100 PSI AND RETURNING 3 BPM.

8:30 19:00 10.50 WOR 10 P REAMED 7" CSG FROM 10111' TO 10303". DRILLED AND REAMED
CEM FROM 10303' TO 10340". TOOK 3 HRS TO GO 34'.
CIRCULATE WELL WELL W/ 300 BBLS.

19:00 19:30 0.50 WOR 39 P TOOH W/ 15-JTS 2 7/8 L-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER AND 12-JTS 2
7/8 BTS-8 TBG. EOT @ 9549'. CLOSED IN WELL CLOSED TIW
VALVE AND INSTALLED NIGHT CAP. CLOSED AND LOCKED PIPE
RAMS. CLOSED CSG VALVES AND INSTALLED NIGHT CAPS.

SDFN.
7/17/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL LOCATION HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING
TUBING FILLED OUT JSA
7:30 10:30 3.00 WOR 39 P 0 TSIP 0 CSIP POOH W/ 309 JTS 2-7/8" BTS 8 TBG X/0 THREE

2-7/8" DRILL COLLARS,X/O, X/O, 6" BLADE REAMER, 4-1/8"
ROCK BIT ROCK BIT WAS PLUGGED OFF WITH CEMENT!
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10:30 13:00 2.50 WOR 39 P L/D 2-7/8" DRILL/COLLARS MU NEW 4-1/8" ROCK BIT,X/O,X/0

TIH W/ 321 JT BTS-8 TBG,X/0 ,18 JTS 2-7/8 8RD EUE
TAGUP@10340(TTL 339 )

13:00  19:00 6.00 WOR 72 P R/U POWER SWIVEL, BRAKE CIRCULATION DOWN CSG CONT
DRILL UP CEMENT PUMPING 2-3/4 BPM RETURNING
2-3/4BPM.FROM 10340 TO 10472. CIRC TBG CLEAN W/90 BBLS
R/D POWER SWIVEL.

19:00  19:30 0.50 WOR 39 P TOOH W/ 22-JTS 2 7/8 L-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER AND 12-JTS 2
7/8 BTS-8 TBG. EOT @ 9549'. CLOSED IN WELL CLOSED TIW
VALVE AND INSTALLED NIGHT CAP. CLOSED AND LOCKED PIPE
RAMS. CLOSED CSG VALVES AND INSTALLED NIGHT CAPS.

SDFN.
7/18/2015 6:30 7:00 0.50 WOR 28 P SAFETY MEETING WITH RIG CREW REVIEW JSA WITH CREW
DRILL OUT CEMENT R/U POWER SWIVEL
7:00 7:45 0.75 WOR 39 P CHECK WELL PRESSURE SITP 0 SICP 0 OPEN WELL UP T.I.LH W/
12 JTB.T.S 2-7/8", X/0 , 23 JT 2-7/8" EUE
7:45 11:00 3.25 WOR 72 P R/U POWER SWIVEL BRAKE CIRC W/ 3 BPM IN, 3 BPM BACK

CONT DRILL UP CEMENT @ 10340 DRILL DOWN 10521 CEMENT
START FALLING IN FROM CSG SWIVEL OUT 7 JT 2-7/8" TBG TO
10320 CIRC 90 BBLS R/D POWER SWIVEL LD 4 JTS 2-7/8" EUE

11:00 14:00 3.00 WOR 39 P TOOH W/ 12 JTS 2-7/8" EUE, X/0, 321 JTS B.T.S 2-7/8", X/0,
X/0,BIT SUB,4-1/8" ROCK BIT
14:00 17:00 3.00 WOR 39 P M/U USED 4-1/8" ROCK BIT, 3-5/8" O.D X 6" TWO BLADE

UNDERREAMER, X/O, X/O , THREE 2-7/8" DRILL COLLARS, X/0,
X/0 AND 313-JTS 2 7/8 BTS-8 TBG. EOT @ 9608'. CLOSED IN
WELL. CLOSED TIW VALVE AND INSTALLED NIGHT CAP.
CLOSED AND LOCKED PIPE RAMS. CLOSED CSG VALVES AND
INSTALLED NIGHT CAPS. SDFN.

7/19/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, POWER SWIVEL CONNECTIONS
0 PSI SITP & SICP
7:30 8:30 1.00 WOR 39 P EOT @ 9608', RIH W/ 22 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, R/U POWER
SWIVEL W/ 1 JT TBG
8:30 16:30 8.00 WOR 10 P BRK CIRC CONV 2.9 BBLS MIN @ 800 PSI, START REAMING 7"

CSG @ 10307', REAM CMT TO 10521', CONT DRILLING &
REAMING TO 10535', DRILL 14" IN 1 1/2 HOUR.

16:30  18:00 1.50 WOR 06 P CIRCULATE CLEAN W/ 300 BBLS 2% KCL.

18:00  19:00 1.00 WOR 39 P R/D POWER SWIVEL, L/D 1 JT 2 7/8" N-80 TBG, TOOH W/ 20 JTS
27/8" N-80 TBG, X/O SUB 8 JTS 2 7/8" BTS TBG.
EOT @ 9608".

CLOSE & LOCK PIPE RAMS, TBG & CSG SHUT IN & NIGHT
CAPPED, SDFN.

DIESEL USED = 96 GAL

7/20/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TBG .
FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 10:30 3.00 WOR 39 P 0 TSIP, 0 CSIP. OPENED WELL TOOH W/ 313-JTS 2 7/8 BTS-8

TBG, X-OVERS AND 3 2 7/8 DRILL COLLARS, BIT SUB, UNDER
REAMER AND BIT.

10:30 13:00 2.50 WOR 39 P RIH W/ 4 1/8 ROCK BIT, BIT SUB, X-OVERS AND 321-JTS 2 7/8
BTS-8 TBG, X-OVER 24-JTS 2 7/8 L-80 EUE TBG. TAGGED CEM
@ 10535' (TTL 345-JTS 2 7/8) RU POWER SWIVEL.

13:00 18:30 5.50 WOR 72 P ESTABLISHED REVERSE CIRCULATION. PUMPING 2.75 BPM AND
RETURNING 2 .75 BPM. DRILLED CEM FROM 10535' TO 10636'.
CIRCULATE TBG CLEAN W/ 90 BBLS RD POWER SWIVEL.
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18:30 19:00 0.50 WOR 39 P TOOH W/ 28-JTS 2 7/8 L-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER AND 8-JTS 2 7/8

BTS-8 TBG. EOT @ 9513'. CLOSED IN WELL CLOSED TIW
VALVE AND INSTALLED NIGHT CAP. CLOSED AND LOCKED PIPE
RAMS. CLOSED CSG VALVES AND INSTALLED NIGHT CAPS.

SDFN.
7/21/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL LOCATION REVIEW JSA HELD SAFETY MEETING
ON DRILL OUT CEMENT
7:30 8:00 0.50 WOR 39 P CHECK PSI SICP 0 SITP 0 OPEN WELL UP TIH W/ 8JTS B.T.S TBG,
X/0, 28 JTS 8RD EUE,
8:00 10:30 2.50 WOR 72 P RU POWER SWIVEL BRAKE CIRC W/ 3 BPM IN , 3 BPM BACK

CONT DRILL UP CEMENT @ 10668 MADE DOWN 10707 START
GET STICKY SWIVEL OUT 2 JTS 2-7/8" CIRC CLEAN W/90 BBLS
R/D POWER SWIVEL

10:30 14:00 3.50 WOR 39 P L/D 8 JTS 2-7/8" FLOAT, TOOH W/ 20 JTS EUE , X/O, 321 JTS
2-7/8"B.T.S X/O, X/O, BIT SUB , 4-1/8" ROCK BIT
14:00 14:30 0.50 WOR 18 P SHUT IN CSG VAVLES CLOSED BLIND RAMS SIWN RIG CREW
CHANGE MAIN DRUM BRAKE PADS
7/22/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P REVIEW JSA W/ RIG CREW TIH W/TBG PINCH POINTS
7:30 10:00 2.50 WOR 39 P 0 SICP M/U 4-1/8" BIT , 2 BLADE UNDERREAMER , X/0 ,X/0,

THREE 2-7/8" DRILL COLLARS , X/0, X/0, TIH W/ 321 JT 2-7/8"
B.T.STBG, X/O, 20 JT 2-7/8" N-80 EUE, R/U POWER SWIVEL
10:00 18:00 8.00 WOR 72 P BRAKE CIRC 3 BPM IN, 3 BPM OUT START REAM CEMENT @
10503 DRILL DOWN 10707 TAG UP HARD CEMENT INCREASE
PUMP RATE MADE DOWN 10732 P/U OFF CEMENT CIRC CLEAN 1
1/2 HRS 420 BBLS
18:00 19:00 1.00 WOR 39 P L/D 1 JT 2-7/8" EUE RD POWER SWIVEL TOOH 26 JTS 2-7/8"EUE
X0 ,8 JTS 2-7/8" B.T.S INSTALL TIW VALVE INSTALL NIGHT
CAP LOCK PIPE RAMS CLOSED ALL MAIN CSG VALVES
INSTALL NIGHT CAPS SDFN

7/23/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P HELD SAFETY MEETING RIG CREW REVIEW JSA TIH R/U POWER
SWIVEL
7:30 8:00 0.50 WOR 39 P SICP 0 SITP 0 UNLOCK PIPE RAMS OPEN WELL UP TIH W/8 JTS
2-7/8"B.T.S, X/0, 27 JTS 2-7/8" EUE, R/U POWER SWIVEL
8:00 18:30 10.50 WOR 72 P BRAKE CIRC, 3 BPM IN, 3BPM OUT, CONT DRILL

UNDERREAMING CEMENT @ 10732 DOWN 10895 CIRC CLEAN
W/420 BBLS R/D POWER SWIVEL TOOH W/ 32 JTS 2-7/8" EUE
,XIO 8 JTS B.T.S TBG

18:30 19:00 0.50 WOR 18 P CLOSED AND LOCK PIPE RAMS CLOSED CSG VALVES NIGHT
CAPS, INSTALL T.L.W VALVE W/ NIGHT CAP S.D.F.N
7/24/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P HELD SAFETY MEETING REVIEW JSAT.LH TBG
7:30 8:00 0.50 WOR 39 P SICP 0 SITP 0 OPEN WELL UP T.I.LH W/ 8 JT 2-7/8"B.T.S , X/0 , 32
JT 2-7/8" EUE R/U POWER SWIVEL W/ JT # 33
8:00 19:00 11.00 WOR 72 P CONT DRILL @ 10895 BRAKE CIRC 3.5BPM IN , 3.5 BPM OUT

MADE DOWN 11124 P/U OFF CEMENT CIRC 1-1/2 HRS 420 BBLS
R/D POWER SWIVEL,

19:00 19:30 0.50 WOR 39 P L/D 1 JT 2-7/8" TBG TOOH 38 JT X/0, 8 JT 2-7/8" B.T.S
19:30 19:30 0.00 WOR 36 P CLOSE PIPE RAMS & LOCK THEM CLOSE MAIN CSG VALVE W/
NIGHT CAPS INSTALL TIW VAVLE W/ NIGHT CAP S.W.I.N
7/25/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P HELD SAFETY MEETING RIG CREW REVIEW JSA
7:30 9:30 2.00 WOR 39 P SICP 0 SITP 0 OPEN WELL UP CONT TOOH W/ 313 JT 2-7/8"

B.T.S, X/O, X/O, THREE 2-7/8" DRILL COLLARS , X/O, X/O,
BIT SUB, 4-1/8" BIT

9:30 14:00 4.50 WOR 39 P REPLACE BLADE UNDERREAMER & 4-1/8" BIT (USED) X/O, X/O,
THREE 2-7/8" DRILL COLLARS, X/O, X/O, TIH W/ 321 X/O, 40 JT
2-7/8" EUE, R/U POWER SWIVEL @ 11,124
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14:00 18:30 4.50 WOR 72 P ESTABLISH PUMP RATE 4 BPM IN, 4 BPM OUT CONT DRILL 11124

DRILL DOWN 11157 2 1/2 HRS CIRC 400 BBLS 1 1/2 HRS R/D
POWER SWIVEL TOOH 40 JT 2-7/8" EUE, 4 JT 2-7/8" B.T.S

18:30 19:00 0.50 WOR 39 P CLOSE PIPE RAMS & LOCK THEM CLOSE MAIN CSG VAVLES
NIGHT CAP, INSTALL TIW VALVE NIGHT CAP, S.D.F.N
7/26/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P HELD SAFETY MEETING CREW ON PINCH POINTS REVIEW JSA
7:30 8:00 0.50 WOR 39 P SICP 0, SITP 0, OPEN WELL UP TIH W/ 4 JT 2-7/8" B.T.S , 40 JTS
2-7/8" EUE R/U POWER @ 11157
8:00 14:00 6.00 WOR 72 P ESTABLISH PUMP RATE @ 4 BPM IN, 4 BPM BACK, 20 BBLS

FILL HOLE CONT DRILL & REAM CSG FROM 11157 HARD
CEMENT DOWN 11180 FELL 30' TO 11210 HARD CEMENT GOT
SOFT @ 11288 REAM DOWN C.I.B.P TAG @11346 CIRC CLEAN
1-1/2 HRS 420 BBLS R/D POWER SWIVIL

14:00 14:30 0.50 WOR 39 P TOOH W/46 JT 2-7/8" EUE , X/O , 4 JTS B.T.S 2-7/8"
14:30 15:00 0.50 WOR 18 P CLOSE PIPE RAMS , LOCK THEM , CLOSE MAIN CSG VAVLE
NIGHT CAPS, INSTALL TIW W/ NIGHT CAP SDFW
7/27/2015 6:00 6:00 24.00 WOR 18 P NO ACTIVITY
7/28/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING
TUBING.FILLED OUT JSA
7:30 10:30 3.00 WOR 39 P TOOH W/ 317-JTS 27/8 BTS-8 TBG, X-OVER, LD 3-2 7/8 DRILL
COLLARS, REAMER AND BIT.
10:30 13:30 3.00 WOR 39 P RIH W/ 5" HD PKR, X-OVERS AND 319 JTS 2 7/8 BTS-8 TBG.

EOT @ 9695'.CLOSED IN WELL. CLOSED TIW VALVE AND
INSTALLED NIGHT CAP. CLOSED AND LOCKED PIPE RAMS.
CLOSED CSG VALVES AND INSTALLED NIGHT CAPS. SDFN.

7/29/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING
TUBING.FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 8:30 1.00 WOR 39 P RIH W/ 2-JTS 2 7/8 BTS-8 TBG, X-OVER AND 49-JTS 2 7/8 -L-80
EUE TBG. EOT @ 11320'.
8:30 10:30 2.00 MIRU 01 P MIRU HALLIBURTONS FRAC EQUIPMENT..
10:30 12:00 1.50 WOR 06 P PRESSURE TEST LINES @ 9000 PSI. OPENED WELL . PUMPED

120 BBLS TO GET CIRCULATION. PUMPED 2000 GALS 15% HCL
ACID. DISPLACED TO 10000' W/ 58 BBLS 2 %KCL.

12:00 14:00 2.00 WOR 39 P TOOH W/ 47-JTS 2 7/8 L-80 EUE TBG. SET PKR @ 9816
PRESSURE TEST PKR @ 1000 PSI HELD. CONTINUED WAITING
FOR 2 HRS TO PUMP ACID.

14:00 15:30 1.50 STGO1 35 P PRESSURE TEST LINES @ 8000 PSI. PUMPED 13000 GALS 15%
HCL ACID W/ 500 BIOBALLS. AVG RATE 11 BPM MAX RATE 11.2
BPM. AVG PRESS 6200 PSI. MAX PRESS 6700 PSI. ISIP 1550 PSI.
5 MIN 1343, 10 MIN 1169, 15 MIN 1016.

15:30 16:00 0.50 RDMO 02 P START RIGGING DOWN HALLIBURTONS FRAC EQUIPMENT.

16:00 18:00 2.00 WOR 39 P CONTINUED RIGGING DOWN HALLIBURTON. TBG DIED
RELEASED PKR TOOH W/ 2-JTS 2 7/8 L-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER
AND 240-JTS 2 7/8 BTS-8 TBG. EOT @ 2534'. CLOSED IN WELL.
CLOSED TIW VALVE AND INSTALLED NIGHT CAP. CLOSED AND
LOCKED PIPE RAMS. CLOSED CSG VALVES AND INSTALLED
NIGHT CAPS. SDFN.

7/30/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TUBING.
FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 8:00 0.50 WOR 39 P 0 CSIP, 0TSIP. OPENED WELL TOOH W/ 81-JTS 2 7/8 BTS-8 TBG,
X-OVERS AND PKR.
8:00 11:30 3.50 WOR 39 P RIH W/ 2 3/8 BULL PLUG, 2-JTS 2 3/8 L-80 TBG. X-OVER, 3 1/2

PBGA, 2'2 3/8 TBG SUB, SN, 4' 2 3/8 TBG SUB 38-JTS 2 3/8
L-80 TBG, X-OVER, 5"TAC, X-OVER, 322-JTS 2 7/8 BTS-8 TBG.
SET TAC @ 9803', SN @ 11012 EOT @ 11114".
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11:30 13:00 1.50 WOR 16 P ND BOPE, LANDED TBG ON B-FLANGE W/ 60' CAP TUBE. NU
WELLHEAD.

13:00 14:30 1.50 WOR 06 P FLUSHED TBG W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL. AND 10 GALS OF
CORROSION INHIBITOR.

14:30 19:00 4.50 WOR 39 N PU AND PRIMED 2" X 1 1/2" X 40' RXBC PUMP, RIH W/ PUMP
9-WIEGHT BARS, 203 3/4"AND 60 7/8". PU AND LAYING DOWN
RODS AS NEEDED LD 23-3/4 " LD 59- 7/8". CLOSED IN WELL PU
POLISH ROD. CLOSED ALL FLOWLINE VALVES. CLOASED
RATIGANS. SDFN.

7/31/2015 | 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON PICKING UP RODS.

FILLED OUT JSA.

7:30 10:30 3.00 WOR 39 P 0 WELL PRESSURE. OPENED WELL. LD POLISH ROD. PU 60-7/8"
W/G, PU 40-1" W/G, RAN 67-1" SLK FROM DERRICK.SPACED
OUT RODS W/ 2-2' X 1" SUBS. PU POLISH ROD FILLED TBG W/
40 BBLS. PRESSURE AND STROKE TEST @ 1000 PSI. HELD.
PRESSURE TEST FLOWLINE @ 1000 PSI.

10:30 12:30 2.00 RDMO 02 P RD RIG. SLID ROTA-FLEX. PUT WELL ON PRODUCTION. TURNED

WELL OVER TO LEASE OPERATOR. CLEANED LOCATION AND
GOT READY TO MOVE TO

August 11, 2015 at 7:41 am
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Sundry Nunber: 75166 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 14.20.H62-1704 '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below

current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION | 7-UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well UTE TRIBAL 2-34Z2
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P. 43013311670000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5138 Ext BLUEBELL
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1223 FSL 1957 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: SESW Section: 34 Township: 01.0N Range: 02.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
] acioize L] acter casing [ casine repar
] NOTICE OF INTENT [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
Approximate date work will start:
O CHANGE WELL STATUS O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS O CONVERT WELL TYPE
v SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: L] oeeren L] rracTure TREAT [J new consTrucTiON
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT O PRODUCTION START OR RESUME O RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE O RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
[ RePERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION (] sipetRACK TO REPAIR WELL [J remporary AsaNDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
O DRILLING REPORT 0 0 0
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION v’ OTHER OTHER: IPump Upsize

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Upsized pump. See attached for details. Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
October 19, 2016

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5138 Consultant
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 10/10/2016

RECEI VED: Cct. 10, 2016




Sundry Nunber: 75166 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000

CENTRAL DIVISION

ALTAMONT FIELD
UTE TRIBAL 2-34Z2
UTE TRIBAL 2-34Z2
WORKOVER LAND

Operation Summary Report

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s) does
(do) not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the possession or
use of the report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this report or any part
thereof, is solely at the user’s own risk.

RECEI VED: Cct. 10, 2016



Sundry Nunber: 75166 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000

CENTRAL DIVISION
1 General
1.1 Customer Information

Company CENTRAL DIVISION
Representative
Address

1.2 Well Information
Well UTE TRIBAL 2-34Z2
Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site UTE TRIBAL 2-34Z2
Rig Name/No. Event WORKOVER LAND
Start date 7/18/2016 End date 7/23/2016
Spud Date/Time 6/19/1986 uwi 034-001-N 002-W 30
Active datum KB @5,922.0usft (above Mean Sea Level)
Afe 166973/57183 / UTE TRIBAL 2-34Z22
No./Description

2 Summary

21 Operation Summary
Date Time Duration Phase Activit | Sub OP MD from Operation
Start-End (hr) y Code Code (usft)
7/20/2016 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, SLIDING ROTAFLEX.
HOT OILER PUMP 100 BBLS 2% KCL DOWN CSG
7:30 9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P SLIDE ROTAFLEX BACK, LOTO ROTAFLEX.
SPOT & R/U RIG
9:00 9:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 42 P P/U ON RODS, UNSEAT PUMP, L/D 1 1/2" X 40' POLISH

ROD,2-2'X1" EL POMIY RODS, PULL UP 3-1" EL RODS,
CLOSE RATIGAN.

9:30 10:00 0.50 PMPNG 24 P HOT OILER FLUSH TBG W/ 70 BBLS 2% KCL @ 200 DEG.

10:00 11:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 42 P POOH W/ 107 1" RODS, 117 7/8" RODS, 203 3/4", 9 CBARS,
2"X 1-1/2"X 38' RXBC PUMP

11:00 12:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P X/O TO TUBING ND W/H ND B FLANGE RELEASE TAC NU
BOPS

12:00 18:00 6.00 PRDHEQ 18 P RU TUBOSCOPE POOH SCANING W/ 322 JNTS 2-7/8"

BTS-8 TUB X/O SUB 38 JNTS 2-3/8" N-80 FLUSHING AS
NEEDED R/D TUBESCOPE CLOSE AND LOCK BLIND RAMS
OPEN CASING TO SALES SDFN

DIESEL USED=88 GALS
PROPANE USED= 200 GAL
2% KCL USED= 200 BBLS

7/21/2016 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P TRAVEL TO LOC. HELD JSA, OVER HEAD LOADS, TAG
LINES
7:30 11:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 18 P MIRU VES RUN GYRO SURVEY FROM 11330 TO SURF. RIG
DOWN VES
11:30 18:00 6.50 PRDHEQ 34 P MIRU HYDRO TEST UNIT TEST PROD TUBING TO 7000

PSI.RIH W/ 2 3/8 BULL PLUG, 2-JTS 2 3/8 L-80 TBG X-OVER,
31/2 PBGA, 2'27/8 TBG SUB, SN, 4'2 7/8 TBG SUB ,
X-OVER, 38-JTS 2 7/8 BTS 8 TBG. X-OVER, 5"X 2-7/8" KLX
1/4 TURN TAC, X-OVER, 322-JTS 2 7/8 BTS-8 TBG. FOUND
NO LEAKS. RD HYDRO TEST UNIT .CLOSED IN WELL
OPEN CSG TO SALES INSTALL TIW VALVE W/ NIGHT CAP
SDFN

DIESEL USED 88GAL
KCL USED 100 BBLS

7/22/2016 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, N/D BOPS
50# SITP & FCP, BLEED OFF

October 10, 2016 at 1:02 pm 1 OpenWells

RECEI VED: Cct. 10, 2016



Sundry Nunber: 75166 APl Well Nunber: 43013311670000

CENTRAL DIVISION
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duration Phase Activit | Sub OP MD from Operation
Start-End (hr) y Code Code (usft)
7:30 9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P R/D FLOOR & TBG TONGS, P/U 2- 6'-2 7/8" N-80 TBG SUBS,

SET KLX 1/4 SET TAC @ 9803" W/ 20K TENSION, N/D &
STRIP OFF BOPS, PULLED 28K OVER TO SET SLIPS
UNDER BOPS, TAC SHEARED, STRIP ON & N/U BOPS, R/U
FLOOR & TBG TONGS

9:00 12:30 3.50 PRDHEQ 18 P TOOH W/ 322 JTS 2 7/8" BTS-8 TBG, X/O, L/D 5" 1/4 SET
TAC.
TAC WAS SHEARED.

12:30 15:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 18 P M/U & RIH W/ NEW 5" 1/4 SET TAC, 322 JTS 2 7/8" BTS-8
TBG, P/U 2-6' TBG SUBS, SET TAC @ 9803' W/ 20K
TENSION.

15:00 16:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P R/D FLOOR & TBG TONGS, N/D & STRIP OFF BOPS, ADD
5K B-FLANGE, LAND TBG ON B-FLANGE, N/U WH, HOOK
UP FLOW LINE.

16:30 18:00 1.50 PMPNG 24 P X/O TO ROD EQUIP. RIH & L/D 49-3/4" EL RODS.
TBG SHUT IN & NIGHT CAPPED, CSG TO SALES, SDFN.

2% KCL PUMPED = 50 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 88 GAL
PROPANE USED = 60 GAL
7/23/2016 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, P/U WEIGHT BARS

50# SITP & FCP, BLEED OFF.
HOT OILER FLUSH TBG W/ 70 BBLS 2% KCL @ 200 DEG,
SPOT 10 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR.

7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 42 P P/U & PRIME APS 2 1/2" X 1 1/2" X 38' RHBC PUMP W/ 2 SV,
RIH W/
19- 1 1/2" C-BARS
154-3/4" EL RODS
147-7/8" EL RODS
107-1" EL RODS
SPACE W/ 1" EL PONY RODS = 1-2', 1-6', 1-8'
P/UNEW 1 1/2" X 40' POLISH ROD, HANG OFF

10:30 11:00 0.50 PMPNG 34 P HOT OILER FILL TBG W/ 40 BBLS 2% KCL, PSI TEST TO
500#, STROKE TEST TO 1000#, GOOD TEST, PSI TEST CV
TO 1000#, GOOD, HOT OILER PUMP 10 BBLS 2% KCL @
200 DEG ACROSS FLOWLINE.

11:00 12:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P RDMO, SLIDE ROTAFLEX IN, CHECK PUMP, NO TAG,
GOOD PUMP ACTION, TWOTO, PWOP.
CLEAN LOCATION, MOVE TO 2-25A1.

2% KCL PUMPED = 150 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 40 GAL
PROPANE USED = 100 GAL

October 10, 2016 at 1:02 pm 2 OpenWells

RECEI VED: Cct. 10, 2016
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