
FormOGC-la SUBMIT IN 2.JPLICATE*
STATE OF UTAH (Other instructions on

reverse side)DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING s. Lease Designation and serial No.

Fee
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL, DEEPEN,OR PLUG BACK 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

la. Type of Work
s. Unit Agreement NameDRII.L DEEPEN PLUG BACK O

b. Type of Well
Oil Gas Single Multiple 8. Farm or Lease Name
Well Well Other Zone Zone

2. Name of Operator Hanson
Utex Oil Company 9. Well No.

3. Address of Operator 2-9B3
1245 E. Brickyard Road, Suite 600, Salt Lake City, Utah 84103 10.FieldandPool,orWildcat

4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State re ements.*
At surface AELE\\/ED 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk.

1,461' FWL 1,531' FSL ) and survey or area
At proposed prod. zone Section 9 T2S R3W, USM

14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office. ocTu 9 1985 12. County or Parrish 13. State

4 miles southeast of Altamont, Utah Duchesne Utah
1õ. Distance from proposed* 16. N nggeOtL 17. No. of acres assigned

location to nearest to this well

o
nera sandrn.

Il e, if any) GAS& MINING 640
18. Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposeil depth 20. Rotary or cable toolsto nearest well, drilling, completed,

or applied for, on this lease, ft· 13,200 . Rotary
21. Elevations (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 22. Approx. date work will start*

5,928' GR October 21, 1985
23.

PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

Size of Hole Size of Casing Weight per Foot Setting Depth Quantity of Cement

12 1/4" 9 5/8" 36# 5,000 circulate to surface
8 3/4" 7" 26# 10,400 as necessary
6 1/8" 5" 18# 13,200 as necessary

Utex controls the land within 660' of the well location

Water Permit #43-9653 is on file with the State of At*ROVED BY THE STATE

CONFllENTIAL o

WE SPACING: O-A

IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM: If proposal is to deepen or plug ek, give data on present productive zone and proposed new pro-
ductive zone. If povosal is to drill or deepen directionally, give pertinent data on subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths. Give blowout
preventer program, if any.
24.

Sinned........ i..... ................

Title.........ExecutiveSecretary October 7, 1985
(This space for Federal or State office use)

Permit No..........................
...-........... Approval Date ......

A pp roved by......................... ......... ................ Title............................... . .... ................ Date. .... ...

Conditions of approval, if any:

*See Instructions On Reverse



LOCAT N THE NE¾ OF THE SW¾ OF

UTEX 0/L CDhfPANY SECTION 9, T2S, R3W, U.S.B.&M.

WELL LOCAT/0N PLAT
HANSON 2-983

N TH

SCALE: l"=lOOO'

HANSON 2-983
GROUND ELEV. 5928'

/46/

80.4 5 Ghs.

LEG END & NOTES SURVEYOR'S CERTIE/CATE
* ORIGINAL CORNERS FOUND AND USED BY THIS

I hereby certify that this plat was prepared
SURVEY- from field notes of an actual survey

performed by me, during which the shown
monuments were found or established.

THE GENERAL LAND OFFICE PLAT WAS

USED FOR REFERENCE AND CALCULATIONS .

J¢y D. IIred, Registered Land
THE BASIS OF BEARINGS FOR THIS SURVEY Sítrveydr, Cert. No. 3817 (Utah)
WAS DETERMINED BY SOLAR OBSERVATIONS .

JERRY D. ALLRED& ASSOCIATES
Surveying& Engineering Consultants

121 North Center Street
y P.O. Drawer C

DUCHESNE. UTAH 8402126 Sept . 1985 79-121-096
(801)
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UTEX OIL COMPANY

SUITE 600
1245 EAST BRICKYARD ROAD
SALT LAKE CITY,UTAHB4106

PHONE (801)484-2262

October 7, 1985

DetapaertmenUto
Natural Resources FIEE(3EEl\/E=.E3

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
355 West North Temple (y gcì 19853 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

DIVISiON OF OIL
GAS & MINiNG

Gentlemen:

Enclosed please find the following:

1. Triplicate copies of Application for Permit to Drill
the Hanson 2-9B3 well, located in the NEh, SW¾of Section
9, Township 2 South, Range 3 West, Duchesne County,
Utah.

2. Triplicate copies of survey plat.
3. Triplicate copies of well layout plat.
4. Triplicate copies of BOP drawing.
5. Triplicate copies of 10 Point Well Prognosis.

We trust this application is complete and in proper form
for your rapid approval of our planned operations. If further
information is required, please contact us at the above address
or telephone number.

We hereby request that this APD and all other information
submitted relative to this well be held confidential for the
maximum allowable period of time.

If I may be of further assistance, please advise.

Sincerely,

D. T. Hansen

DTH/mm



AÑA ANAOctober 7, 1985
RECEIVED

UTEXOIL COMPANY
10 Point Well Prognosis C3T09 1985

Hansen 2-983

1. Surface formation: Tertiary Uinta FormationGIAS & Minnah3

2. Estimated tops of geologic markers: Top Green River 3,900
Top Wasatch 10,590

3. Estimated depths to water, oil and gas or mineral bearing formations:

0-3,900 Uinta - Water bearing
3,900-10,590 Green River - Oil, Gas and Water

10,590 to T.D. Wasatch - Oil, Gas and Water

4. Casing program: Size Weight Grade Depth

9 5/8" 36# J-55 5,000'
7" 26# N-80 10,400'
5" 18# N-80 13,200'

5. Pressure control equipment: See diagram attached to APD.
Blowout preventers: A series 1500, 5000 psi W.P.
hydraulically operated double ram type preventer, with pipe and blind
rams, and a 5000 psi, Hydril type preventer will be used.
A 5,000 psi W.P. hydraulic choke manifold, PVT, and flow sensors will
be used.
Testing Procedure: Before drilling out each casing string, blowout pre-
venters, casing head, and casing will be pressure tested, and blowout
preventers will be checked for proper operation each day.

6. Type and characteristics of proposed circulating medium:
0-5,000 Fresh water with gel sweeps
5,000-10,400 Fresh gel mud lightly treated, water loss controlled

below 7,000'.
10,400-T.D. Fresh gel mud, weighted, treated and dispersed as

necessary.
Approximately 800 barrels of circulating fluid and
adequate bulk barite will be maintained on site.

7. Auxillary Equipment:
Upper and lower kelly cocks will be used, and a full opening valve will
be maintained on the rig floor. A mud logging unit is planned from
7,000' to total depth with 24 hour supervision.

8. Testing and Coring:
No DST's are planned
DIL with S.P. and G.R., FD-CN

9. Anticipated Hazards:
No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No hydrogen
sulfide is present in this area.

10. Anticipated starting date:
October 21, 1985 with duration of operations approximately 90



0 0

UTEX DRILLING CO.

BOP STACK

ROTARY TABLE KELLY(with lower kelly cock,5OOO lbs.)

10" 1500 SERIES 6" 1500 SERIES FLANGE
ROTATING HEAD

ORBlT VALVE
BLOOlE LINE

)
10" 1500 SERIESP I PE RAMS SHAFFER
DOUBLE- GATE

BLIND RAMS

3 KILL LINES 3" OPENING FOR CHOKE
SYSTEM, 5000 lbs.

SERIES 1500 EOUlPMENT IS 5000 PSI RATED

NOT TO
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LOCATED IN THE NEi OF THE SWi OF

SECTÏON 9, T2S, R3W, U.S.B.&M.

UT PL A T RECEIVED
-983 ocT 0 9 1985

DIVISiON OF OIL
GAS & MINING

LOGATION SUHFAGE3928
4 m

/
RESERVE P/T |

//"-50' S TA. 4+60

GUT

LOCATION SUREACE5926-

"
RESERVE P/T'

\ //"- 50' STA. 2+30

LOGATION SURFAGE *s,3928

/" so' S TA. 0+00

- 8 - o I

8
F/LL

QUANT/T/ES }.-zs' I J'-+-s'-!

APPROX/hfATE CUT 28,000 Cu. Yds.
KEYWAY A A

APPROX/MATE E/L L 2, 400 Cu Yds.

JERRY D. ALLRED & ASSOCIATES
Surveying & Engineering Consultants

121 North Center Street
P.O Drawer C

DUCHESNE. UTAH 84021
26 SEprEMBEN /983 79 -12/-096 (801)
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R/GHT-OE-WAY AND USE Ë0UNÐARY SURVEY
HANSON 2-983

U7EX O/L COMPANY

DESCRIPTION OF USE BOUNDARY

eginning at a point which is South 56°04'24" East 1468.94 feet from the
West Quarter Corner of Sedtion 9, Township 2 South, Range 3 West of the
ßintah Special Base and Meridian:

Thence South 71°54'09" East 570 feet;

Thence South 18°05'57" West 400 feet;

Thence North 71°54'09" West 570 feet:

Thence North 18°05'51" East 400 feet to the Point of Beginning, containing

$.23 acres.

DESCRÏPTION OF RIGHT-OF-WAY

Ad3 feet yide right-of-was er part DO Section 9, Township 2 South,

Range 3 We t of the Uintah 3pecial base ane Meridian, the centerline of

said right-of-way t>eing fufther descrioed as ellows:

Beginning at a point on the Sout ide of an existing road, said point being

North 1A°19'33" East 542.16 fee from the West Quarter Corner of said Section 9;
Thence South 3°45'27" East 454.21 feet:

ThencT35uth 26°12'07" East 371.76 feet;

Thence South 35°31 '16" East 271.76 feet

Thence South 48°08'56" East 295.87 feet;

Thence South 70 08'28" East 410.86 feet;

Thence South 71 24'11" East 119.93 feet to the Utex Oil Company, HANSON2-983

weil location, containing 1.46 acres.

SURVEYOR'S CERTIFICATE

This is to certífy that under my persónal supervidion a survey was made of the

parcels shown on this plat and that this plat ac urately represents said survey

to .the best of my knowledge.

Jer D. llred, Registered Land

Surveyor, Cert. No. 3817 (Utah)

JERRY D. ALLRED& ASSOCIATES
Surveying& Engineering Consultants

121 North Center Street
P.O. Drawer C

DUCHESNE.UTAHEWO2179- /2/ - S A (801)



OPERATOR DATE TJr
WELLNAME fx"S-

SEC //F.stJ T ..CS R JA/ COUNTY

0/3 3HA
API NUMBER TYPE OF LEASE

CHECKOFF:

PLAT BOND NEARESTWELL

LEASE / FIELD POTASHOR
OIL SHALE

PROCESSINGCpMMENTS:

APPROVALLETTER:

SPACING: A-3 c-3-a //g VA
UNIT CAUSENO. & DATE

c-3-b C-3-c

STIPULATIONS

11/2/84



O O
STATEOF UTAH Norman H. Bangerter. Gove
NATURALRESOURCES Dee C. Hansen, Executive Dee

Oil, Gas & Mining Dianne R. Nielson. Ph.D., Division Dire r

355 W. North Temple • 3 Triod Center• Suite 350 • Salt Lake City, UT84180-1203 · 801-538-5340

October 16, 1985

Utex Dil Company
1245 E. Brickyard Road, Suite 600
Salt Lake City, Utah 84106

Gentlemen:

Re: Well No. Hanson 2-9B3 - NE SW Sec. 9, T. 25, R. 3W
1531' FSL, 1461' FWL - Duchesne County, Utah

Approval to drill the above-referenced oil well is hereby granted in
accordance with the Order of Cause No. 139-42 dated April 17, 1985 subject to
the following stipulations:

1. The location shall be diked or trenched and natural drainages shall
be diverted to prevent any influent to or effluent from the location.

In aodition, the following actions are necessary to fully comply with
this approval:

1. Spudding notification to the Division within 24 hours after drilling
operations commence.

2. Submittal to the Division of completed Form OGC-8-X, Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling.

3. Prompt notification to the Division should you determine that it is
necessary to plug and abandon this well. Notify John R. Baza,
Petroleum Engineer, (Office) (801) 538-5340, (Home) 298-7695, or
R. 3. Firth, Associate Director, (Home) 571-6068.

4. Compliance with tne requirements and regulations of Rule C-27,
4ssociated Gas Flaring, General Rules and Regulations, Oil and Gas



0 g

Page 2
Utex Oil Company
Well No . Hanson 2-9B3
October 16, 1985

5. This approval shall expire one (1) year after date of issuance unless

substantial and continuous operation is underway or an application

for an e×tension is made prior to the approval expiration date.

The API number assigned to this well is 43-013-31136.

Sincerely,

R. . Fi th
Associat Director, Oil & Gas

as
Enclosures
cc: Branch of Fluid



w/0k

DIVISIONOFOIL,GASANDMINING

SPUDDINGINFOFfnTION
API #43-013-31136

NAMEOFCOffANY: UTEX OIL COMPANY

WELLNAME: HANSON TRUST 2-983

SECTION NE SW 9 TOWNSHIP PS RANGE SW COUNTY Duchesne

DRILLINGCONTRACTOR Har<1tock Pat How

RIG#
SPUDDED:DATE 12-18-85

TIME 9:00 AM

ÑOW Dry Hole Digger

DRILLINGWILL COMMENCE Utex Drilling #2

REPORTEDBY Connie Romero

TELEPHONE# 738-5798

DATE 12-19-85 SIGNED



- FormOGC-lb SU lN TRil'fJC\TE*
ATE OF UTAH er instructions on

reverse wir)DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 6. LEASE DEarGNATION .tND BERIAL NO.

Fee
6. If INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TalšE NAMESUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON ()(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a i .Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for auch proposals.)

1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAMEorL GAa AN2 2 1986waLI. wmLL oTsza
2. NAME 07 OPEEATOS 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

UTEX OIL COMPANY ur DIL
HANSON TPURT3. ADDRESS 07 OPERATOR GAS & MINING s. w=ra. no·

Suite 600, 1245 East Brickyard Road, SLC, Utah 84106 2-9B3
4. LocATION or wmLL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any Stàte requirements.• 10. riaLD AND PooL, os WILoc&TSee also space 17 below.)

It surface
Altamont
11. SEC.. T., A., M., OR BLE. AND

BURVET OR ARMA
1,461' FWL 1,531' FSL

Sec. 9 T2S R3W USM14. PERMIT NO. 15. BLEVATIONs (Show whether or, ar, an, etc.) 12. couNTY om rantaa 18. stars
43-013-31136 5,928' GR Duchesne Utah

6· CheckAppropnate BoxTo Indicate Nature of Notice, Report,or Other Data
NOTICE 07 INTENTION TO: SUBBEQUENT REPORT 07:

TEST WATER BRUT<)rr PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-Orr REPAIRINO WELL
FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATHENT AE.TERING CASING

RSHOOT OR ALCLIDIZE ABANDONPLANS sisohe )NG OR A IDIZINO ABANDONMENT*

(Norm: Report results of multiple completion on Well(Other) (•ontpletion or Recompletton Report and Log form.)
17. DESCRIB$ PROVOSED OR CUMPLETED OPERATIONs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting anyproposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-nent to this work.) *

SPUDDED WELL AT 11:30 P.M. ON JANUARY 4, 1986

January 5, 1986 through January 12, 1986
Drilled from O' to 4,000' in the Uintah Formation
Ran 96 joints of 9 5/8" 36# casing, cemented

CONFllENTW

Page 1
18. I hereby certify that the for ng is true and correct

APP"ovED BT TITLE DATE
Cumus 'IS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

See Instructionson Reverse



EormeG lb SL" 'T 1\ FRIN.Il \ll
TATE OF UTAH er instrarnons on

DEPAATMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 6· 'sana DESIONATION AND SERIAL NO.

Fee
SUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS(Do not use this forza for prooossis to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.Use "APPIJCATION FOR PERMIT-" for auch proposais.)

1.
7. (1NIT AGENEMSMT NAMSELLI.

war.L oTass
2. Naxa or orzaatos 8. raan on t.sass waxa

Utex Oil Company
Hanson Trust3. ADDassa or GPsaatos 9. was.l. No.

Suite 600, 1245 East Brickyard Road, Salt Lake City, Utah 84106 2-9B3
4. r.ocation or watt (Report locattoa clearly sad in aceordance with any Atacerequiressents.• 10. Psar.o ano roor., os war.ocarSA suLdsospace 17 below.)

1,461' FWL 1,531' FSL
14. PsautT No. 16. BLB¥ATIOWS ( w wheth

43-013-31136 5r928' GR
16· CheckAppropnete BoxTo Indice

ACTIONnosses or rysseson so: NAME CODE(S) INTL
TzaT wataa sawT-orf PUT.L 05 AI.TER CASIWO NORM
FRACTURE TREAT MCLTIPLE COMPLETE

VICKYSNOOT OR ACIDI38 ABANDON*

CLAUD1AREPAIR WELL , CitANGS PLANS

STEPHANE(Other)

CHARLËS17. DESCRIBE Pnnposmp na CUM1•LETED OPERATIONs (Clearly state nil pert
proposed work. If weil is directionally drilled. sive subsurfae. RULA , £,nens to this work.) *

MARY AL1CE / A (CONNIEJanuary 13, 1986 through January MILLIË '
Drilled from 4,000' to 7,855' in PAM
January 20 , 198 6 through January Require d Actio n CodeDrilled from 7,855' to 10, 264' i 1. Data Entry

2. FilmingJanuary 27, 1986 through February 3. PostingDrilled from 10,264' to 10,746' i a. Card IndexRan a total of 246 joints of 7" 2 b. File Label
c. ListsFebruary 3, 1986 through February 4. Bonding VerificationDrilled from 10,746' to 11,444' i 5. Other (See Norm)

February 10, 1986 through Februar
Drilled from 11,444' to 12,268' i

CONFilENTIR
Page 2

(This space t Few or State omee use)

APP" VED BT TITLE DATE
Caum., 5 OF APPROVAL, 17 ANT:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse



Form eCC-lb
SL i l\ ERIPLO \ f! -

TATE OF UTAH er instruenon, on

if DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 6 'saan osasonarron suo amaram no.

Fee
SUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS 6. If INDIAN, ALI.OTTSB OR TalBE NAME

(Do not use this form for proDosals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.Use "APPflCATION FOR PERMIT-" for auch progoesta.)
1.

7. t]NIT AGESEMSMT NAME
LL waLL OTass

2. NAMS OF OPERATOS
8. FARM 08 t.3ASS NAMEUtex Oil Company
Hanson Trust3. ADDESSS OF OPUSA205

9. WELL NO.
Suite 600, 1245 East Brickyard Road, Salt Lake City, Utah 84106 2-9B3

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with aar Ataterequirements.• 10. stat.» Ano roor., os war.acarSee also space IT below.)at surface
Altamont

11. esc.. T., s., M., os aLE. Axe
80BTET 08 ASSA

1,461' FWL 1,531' FSL Sec. 9 T2S R3W USM14. Fa5MIT No. 18. BLaTAttons (Show whether or, ar. aa, ets.) 12. COUNTT 08 PARIBM 18. STATS
43-013-31136 \ 5 r 928 ' GR Duchesne Utah

©· OleckAppropnete BoxToIndicateNatureof Notice,Repon,or OdierDate
nosses or syssasson so: sessaousse issoas or:

TEST WATSB BRUT•OFF PULL 08 ALTER CAstNO WATSB SRUT479 REPAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASIWo
SHOOT OR ACIDI38 ABANDON* SROUTING OR A€lDISINO ABANDOMMENT*
nerAta wmLL ettANem Pr.ama (Other)

((Vots: Report results of muittpie completion on Wel(Other) ( umpletion or Recompletton Report and Ug form.)17. ossextos rnovosso na cuMt•LETED oPERATIons (Clearly state nit pertinent details. and give pertinent dates. Inetuding estimated date of starting anyproposed work. If weil is directionally drilled, give subsurface toestions and measured and true vertteal depths for all markers and zones pertt•nens to this work.) •

January 13, 1986 through January 19, 1986
Drilled from 4,000' to 7,855' in the Green River formation

January 20, 1986 through January 26, 1986
Drilled from 7,855' to 10, 264' in the Green River formation

January 27, 1986 through February 2, 1986
Drilled from 10,264' to 10,746' in the Wasatch formation
Ran a total of 246 joints of 7" 26# casing, cemented.

February 3, 1986 through February 9, 1986
Drilled from 10,746' to 11,444' in the Wasatch formation

February 10, 1986 through February 16, 1986
Drilled from 11,444' to 12,268' in the Wasatch formation

CONFllENTIAL
Page 2

TS. I bereby certify that the to ing is true and correct

(Ña space t Federal or State ogee use)

APP" VED ST TITLE DATE
CWwn.. 8 OF APPROVAL, 17 ANT:

*SeeInstmetionsen Reverse



Eorm OGC-lb S IN TKil'LIE \TI
TATE OF UTAH

L ler
instna pons ond reverse slo

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5· 'saan ossionarron suo saarse no. *

Fee

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a diŒerent reservoir.Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

7. UNIT AGRESMENT NAMEOIL GAS
WELL WILL OTHER

2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FABAt 08 LSABE N&MB
Utex Oil Company

Hanson Trust3. ADDEBBS OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

Suite 600, 1245 East Brickyard Road, Salt Lake City, Utah 84106 2-9B3
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearir and in aceordance with any State requtrements.• 10. 7181.0 AND POOL, 05 Wit.DCATSee also space 17 below.)at surta*•

Altamont
11. BBC. T., 8.. M.. 05 SLE. AND

BUSTET 08 ASSA

1, 461' FWL 1, 531' FSL
Sec. 9 T2S R3W USM

14. Pzantz No• 15. St.BTATIONs (Show whether or, ar, on, ete.) 12. county os raassa 18. stats
43-013-31136 5,928 ' GR Duchesne Utah

te· CheckAppropnete BoxTo IndicateNatureof Notice,Report,or OtherData
NOTICE OP IgTENTION TO: SUggšQUENT 88708T OF:

TEST WATSB BRUT•OFP PULL 08 ALTER CASING WATER SHUT•OPP REPAIRtNO WELL
FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPI maTHENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON·

REPAIR WELL CilANGE PLANS NA

1Î. DESCRIDE PROVOSED OR CUMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clent rting any
thi r *

well is directionally drilled. g onesperti-

CLAUDIA
February 17, 1986 through Febra

SCTE HLANE --

Drilled from 12,268' to 13,200' ROLA --

February 24, 1986 through Febrt CONNIEDrilled from 13,200' to 13,200 MILLIERan 69 joints of 5" 18# casing PA MT.D. of 13, 200 ' on February 23
1G

RIG RELEASED AT 11:59 P.M. ON Re4Gired Aetion Code
1. Data Entry2. Filming
3. Posting

a. Card Index
b. File Label
c. Lists

4. Bonding Verification5. Other (See Norm)

I

18. I hereby tity that the for g is true and

(This space to Federal or State odice use)

APP"^VED BY TITLE DATE
CW.vu 8 OF APPROVAL, IF ANT:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse



Form OGCJb SL l RIPI \TI' L TATE OF UTAH er notructions oná
reverse wir)DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

D1VISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5· 'sasa osa!ONATION AND BERIAL ff0.
.

Fee
6. IP INDIAN. ALLOTTSB OR TRIBE 'fAMESUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.Use "APPLICATION FOR PERWIIT-' for sueh proposals.)

7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAMEOIL GAS
WELL WELL OTHER

2. NAMS OP OPERATOS
8. FARM 08 LEAss NAMEUtex Oil Company
Hanson Trust3. Angassa 09 OFSEATOR
9. WELI. NO.

Suite 600, 1245 East Brickyard Itoad, Salt Lake City, Utah 84106 2-9B3
4. r.ocattoN or wsLL (Report location clearly and in accordance wtta any State requirements.• 10. Ptat.o AND Poor., os witocarSee also space 17 below.)at sorta**

Altamont
11. sac. T., a., x, omar.x. Axo

80878T 08 AREA
1, 461' FWL 1, 531' FSL

Sec. 9 T2S R3W USM14. 3a-
13-31136

15. ELEVATrows (Show whether or, at, on, etc.) 12. cogstr omæranssa 18. stata

le' CheckAppropnete BoxTo IndicateNatureof Notice,Report,or OtherData
NOTICS 07 IgTENTION TO: SUSSEQU3NT BSPOST 07:

TžšT WATES BEUT•0FF PUT.L OR ALTER CAstNG WATax 5HUT-orp REPAIRtNo WELL
FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE ¢OMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON*

SROUTING OR AflDISING ABANtaONMENT*
REPAIR WELL CilANGE PLANs (Other) Drilling

(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel(Other) (smpletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)17. Descains rnovosso na coMt•LETED OPERATIONS (ÛÎêurly $(StP all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting anyproposed work. If well is directionally drilled. give subsurfsee locations and measured and trtte vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-nent to this work.) *

February 17, 1986 through February 23, 1986
Drilled from 12,268' to 13,200' in the Wasatch formation

February 24, 1986 through February 27, 1986
big 2 1Drilled from 13,200' to 13,200' in the Wasatch formation

Ran 69 joints of 5" 18# casing, cemented.
T.D. of 13, 200 ' on February 23, 1986 DIVISIONOF

OIL GAS &MINING
RIG RELEASED AT 11:59 P.M. ON FEBRUARY 26, 1986

CONRDENR
Page 3

18. I hereby tity that the nd correct

riot,g Secretary ago, S-
pa e to Federal or State oAce use)

APT"^VED ST TITLE DATE
Co.uu S OF APPROVAI4 IF ANT:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse



orm UGC-3
SUBMIT IN DUP E* 56 64 01

STATE OF UTAH tSee other instructrons

DEPARTMENT OF NATURA L RESOURCES
on reverse side)

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5. LEASE DESEGNATIOil AND BERIAL NO.

FEE
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTSB OB TRIBE NAMEWELLCOMPLETION OR RECOMPLETIO N/Ais. TYPE OF WELL

v LL t.yt,L DET (y 7. UNIT A0BEEMENT NAME

k TYPE OF COMPLETION:

EL
OTOttR" O :" O RO n'.'v.. o,,,)UN19 886 8. rang og I.EASE NAME

2. NAME OF OPERATOn Hanson Trust
UTEXOIL COMPANY DIVISIONOF e. •= . mo·

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOs L. ING 2-983
1245 E. Brickyard Rd., Ste. 600, Salt Lake City, Utah 84106 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

4. LOCATION or wzLI. (Report location clearly and in accordance saith any ßtate requirc.ents>• Al tamontat.nea* 1,461' FWL; 1,531' FSL NESW 11.SEC..T.,R.,x.,0xsLOCKANDSURVEY
OR AREA

At top prod. interval reported below
Sec. 9, T2S, R3W, USM

At total depth

. PERMIT NO.
PARISH

\ 43-013-31136 /16/85 Duchesne Utah
15. DATE SPCDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 1Î. DATE COMPL. (Ready to prod.) LE:VATroNs (Dr, ass, RT, om, ETC.). 19. ELET. ChalNGHEAD

1/4/86 \ 2/22/86 3/14/86 i 5,928' GR 5,928'
20. TorAL DErrx, MD & TTD 21. PLUO, BACK T.D., MD A TVD 22. IF Mr LTIPLE COMPL., 23. INTERVALS ROTART TOOLS CABLE TOOLE

HOW MANT* DRILLED BT
13,200' 13,196' I 0-TD \

.

N/A
24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION-TOP, BOTTON, NAME (MD AND TTD)e 25. WAS DIRECTIONAL

SURVET MADM

10,674' - 13,204' Wasatch No
26. TTPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER GS RUN 24. WAS WELL CORED

IiÍL, F N AL No
28. CASING RECORD (Report all strings set in toen)

CASING SIZE WEIGHT, LB./FT. DEFTH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED

9-5/8" 36# 4,000' 124" 1,735 sx None
7" 26# 10,400' 8-3/4" 1,340 sx None

29. LINER RECORD 30. TUBING RECORD
SIZE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPTE BET (MD) PACEgg SET (MD

5" 10,224' 13,200' 450 2-7/8" 10,264' 10,264'
2-3/8" 4,997' Heat String

Šl. raarORATION RECORD (Ìnterval,ai; and nung er) 82. ACID, SHOT. FRACTURE. CEMENT SQUEEZE. ETC.
DEPTR INTERVAL (MD) AMOUNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL UBED

161' net; 3 shots/foot; 483 holes 10,674'-13,204' 18,000 gallons 15% HCL
13,500 gallons 2% KCL

See Attached List

33.• PRODUCTION
DATE FIRST PRODUCTION I PRODUCTION MiiHLD (ÈJosping, gas lift, pumping-size sad type of pump) war,L sTATua (Producing or

shut-in)
3/14/86 I 4 Flogng Producing

DATE OF TEST HOtas TESTED CHOKE SIZE PROD'N. FOR OIL-BÉL. GAS--MCT. WATER--BBL. GAS-OIL BATIO
TEST PERIOD i I

5/5/86 72 14/64" - | 1,668 | 2,280 232 1.37:1
¶lAlW. TU3tNG 78-55. CASING PRESSURE CALCULATED OIL--88L. GAS-MCF. WATER-BBL. OIL GRATITT-API (CORE.)

24-ROCR RATE
1,400 -0- - 556 760 77 43°

$4. DISPOBïTION OF GAS (ÑOld, sacd for fugl, vented, clC.) TEaT WITNEsšED BT

Sold . Don Baucum
35. LIST OF ATTACEMENTE

Perforation List
36. I hereby certif that t for og and att .bed information is complete and correct as determined from all available records I

SIGNED . TITLE ŸrOduction Engineer DATE 6/17/86
*(SeeInstructionsord Soocesfor Additional Data on Rev•rse



INSTRUCTIONS
Generei: This form is designed for submitting a complete and correct well completton report and tog on all types of lands and leases to either a Federal agency or a State agency,
or both, pursuant to applicable Federal and/or State laws and regulations. Any m-eessary special Instructions concerning the use of this form and the number of copies to be
submitted, particularly with regard to local, area, or regional procedures and practices, either are shown below or will be issued by, or may be obtained from, the local Federal
and/or State ofnce. See instructions on items 22 and 24, and 33, below regarding separate reporta for separate completions.
If not Bled prior to the time this summary record is submitted, copies of all rurrently available logs (drillers, geologista, sample and core analysis, all types electric, etc.), forma-
tion and pressure testa, and directional surveys, should be attached hereto, to the extent required by applicable Federal and/or State lawa and regulations. All attachmenta
should be listed on this form, see item 35.
Item 4: If there are no applicable State requirements, lõeations on Federal or Indian land should be described in accordance with Federal requirements. Consult local State
or Federal oince for specine instructions.
Item 18: Indleate which elevation is used as reference (where not otherwise shown) for depth measurements given in other spaces on this form and in any attachments.
Items 22 and 24: If this well is completed for separate production from more than one interval zone (multiple completion), so state in item 22, and in item 24 abow the producing
interval, or intervals, top(e), bottom(s) and name(s) (if any) for only the intervat reported in item 88. Submit a separate report (page) on this form, adequately identided,
for each additional interval to be separately produced, showing the additional data pertinent to such interval.
item 29: "ßacks Censent": Attached supplemental records for this well should show the details of any multiple stage cementing and the location of the cementing tool.
Item 33: Submit a separate completion report on thhí form for each interval to be separately produced. (See instruction for itema 22 and 24 above.)

O

37. BUMMARY OP POROUS EONES:
BHOW ALE, IMPORTANT EONES OF POROSITY AND CONTENTS THERSOP; 00BED IMTERTALS; AKD ALL DRILL--TEM TagTS, INCLoosse | 88. OBOLOGIC MARKERS
DEPTH INTERVAL TESTED, CUSHION USED, TIME TOOL OPEN, FLOw!NO AND BRUT-IN PRESSURES, AND BBCOVaalms ·

TORMATION toP BOTTOM DESCRIPTION, CONTENTS, BTC. TOP
NAME

Lower Green River 9,067' 10,670' Oil, gas & water ""* """" '*""'''""""

Wasatch 10,670' NR Oil, gas & water Lower Green RiVEr 9,067'

Carbonate Marker 10,472'

Wasatch 10,670'



PERFORATIONs JUN 19 1986
RANSONTRUST 2-983

DIVISION OF
Depths from DIFL dated 2/23/86 OIL GAS &MINING

Open hole logs are recorded 36' deep
compared with drilling depth

10,674-76
-2 11,609-11 2 12,543-45 2

10,689-91 2 11,637-40 3 12,549-51 2
10,705-07 2 11,724-26 2 12,629-32 3
10,710-12 2 11,731-33 2 12,652-54 2
10,744-46 2 11,780-82 2 12,754-56 2
10,755-57 2 11,817-19 2 12,765-67 2
10,781-83 2 11,844-86 2 12,780-82 2
10,809-11 2 11,894-96 2 12,789-91 2
10,828-30 2 11,912-14 2 12,829-31 2
10,861-63 2 11,951-53 2 12,876-78 2
10,882-84 2 12,044-46 2 12,904-06 2
10,889-91 2 12,054-56 2 12,909-11 2
10,900-02 2 12,101-03 2 12,914-17 3
10,919-21 2 12,114-16 2 12,944-47 3
10,925-27 2 12,158-60 2 12,995-97 2
10,958-60 2 12,176-78 2 13,014-16 2
10,997-99 2 12,189-91 2 13,024-26 2
11,145-47 2 12,219-21 2 13,044-46 2
11,180-82 2 12,250-53 3 13,066-68 2
11,249-51 2 12,294-96 2 13,083-85 2
11,338-40 2 12,320-22 2 13,130-32 2
11,408-11 3 12,390-92 2 13,139-41 2
11,434-36 2 12,425-27 2 13,157-59 2
11,478-80 2 12,467-69 2 13,177-79 2
11,511-13 2 12,481-83 2 13,202-04 2
11,533-35 2 12,518-21 3

77 Zones
161'



Form OGC.lb illT IN TitiPl.It \11'
STATE OF UTAH (Other in inn pans on

rewr uh )DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
D1VISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5, LEASE DE3t0NATION LND BERIAL NO.

SUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS(Do not use this form for pronosals to drül or to deepen or plus back to a diferent reservoir.Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-'' for such proposais.)
I' T. UNIT AGassMENT NAME

GIL GAS
wsLL War.L OTRES

2. NAMS 07 OPERATOR O. PARAt 05 L3Aas NAME

ANR Limited Inc.
. ADDREBS OF OPERATOR

. WELI. NO.
P. O. Box 749, Denver, Colorado 80201-

4. LOCATION OF WELL ( 000Tt 10Cat100 Citti 7 40 in ACC07 BB©t With to giggggggg,• O. FIELD AND FOOL, OR WH.DCATSee also space 17 below.)
At surface DEC311986

11. BBC.. T., E., M., OR BLE. AND
See attached list suarar os assa

n!!DIVISI OF
14. Psault No. ii. 3LSTATIONS (Show whether or, xT, aa, ete.) 12. ouxTT os FAston 18. s:ATE

ŸJ ·d/3• 3//37. I
te· CheckAppropnete BoxTo Indicate Natureof Notice, Report,or OtherData

NoTICE 07 INTsNTIOW 20: susasquaxt aarosT or:

TEST WAT3R BRUT•0FF PUT.L OR ALTER Cas!NO WATER BRUT-Orp REFAIRING WELL

FRACTiiBE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE PRACTURE TasATHENT ALTERING CastNO

SNOOT na ACIDI35 ABANDON* SHOUTING OR ACIDit!NO ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLAus (Other)
X incts: Report re.uits et multivie completson on wou(Other) - Change Operator -A (uniptetton ur Rrcomµletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIDE runyngEn nm CUMPLETED OPERATIONs (Clearly stato all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If w•lt is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertteal depths for all markers and zones pert!-
nons to this work.) •

ANR Limited has been elected successor Operator.to Utex Oil Company
on the oil wells described on the attached Exhibit 'A".

18. I hereby ty that the toregoing is true and correct

BIGNED TITLE DATE

AP""'WED BT TITLE DATE
Cuisvax.. 5 OF APPROVIL, IF ANT:

*SeeInstruct¡onson Revers.



I'orm OGC-Ib SUBM Titll'I ICATI
STATE OF UTAH (Other instructions on

reverse side)
DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5, LEASE DEglONATION AND 88BIAL WO.

Fee
$. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTES OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS 120150(De not see this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plut back to a diRerent reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for seek proposals.) N/A

• T. UNIT AORSEMENT NAME

OIL PIN OAS
wSLL L. I WRI.I. OTEMS N/A

3. Nama or orsaatos 8. raan on t.sass naus

ANR Limited Inc. 9 e Hanson Trust
s. anomass or ormasso. NOV- - 1987 ,, ,,,.....

P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 2-9B3
4. LOCAT30N OF WEI.L (Report loestion clearly and in accordance with any State tegüireardätsk• 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

See also space 1T below,)
At sortaee Altamont

11. e-c., T., a., M., omBLE. AND
BURTET OR ABBA

1461' FWL & 1531' FSL
Sec, 9-T28-R'.W

14. PERMIT NO. 18. MIÆVATIONE (Show whether Dr. RT, 05, etc.) 12. COUNTT 05 PARIEN 18. STATE

43-013-31136 5928' GL Utichesne Utah
te CheckAppropnate BoxTo Indicate Natureof Notice, Report,or OtherData

NOTICE OF INTENTION 20 : BUBBBQUENT REPORT OF :

TEST WATER SEUT•OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-Orr REPAIRING WELL

PRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CABING

BMOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* BHOUTING OR ACIDiltNG ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CilANGE PLANs (Other)
ConverteT¯to Artifical Lift X

(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well
¯

(Other) ('ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DEscainE rununsmo on t uMPLETED UPERATIONs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting nny
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti
nent to this work.) *

5-29-87 well converted from flowing well to hydraulic lift.

18. I høreby the regoing i and correct

BIGNED TITLE Regulatory Analyst vars 11 /17 /87
(y Aen Dey _ _

(This space for Federal or State oSce u )

APPROVED BT TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, 17 ANT:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse



O 9 DOGM 56-64-21
an equal opportunity employer

U1AH
NATURALRESOURCE:
011. Gos & Mining

355 West North Temple, 3 Triad Center, Suite 350, Salt Loke City, Ut 10 10
84 1203.O(801-538-5340) pg _ og

MONTHLY OIL AND GAS PRODUCTIONREPORT

Operator name and address:

*ANR LIMITED INC./COASTAL Utah Account No. NO2 5
P 0 BOX 749
DENVER CO 80201 0749 Report Period (Month/Year) Il / $Ï
ATTN: RANDYWAHL

Amended Report

Well Name Producing Days Production Volume

API Number Entity Location Zone Oper Oil (BBL) Gas (MSCF) Water (BBU
BROTHERSON2-284
4301330855 08420 025 04W 2 WSTC

'BURTON 1-1585
A301330128 08421 025 oSW 15 wsTC
BROTHERSON1-23BAR
130133048308423 025 04W 23 wsTC
HANSON TRUST 2-29A3
%30133104310205 015 03W 29 WSTc
BABCOCK2-12B4
4301331005 10215 025 04W 12 wsTC
E SWORTH#2-16BA

1331046 10217 025 o4w 16 wsTC
UTÉTR IBAL #2-33Z2
630133111110451ilN 02W 33 wsTC
ROBB 2-2985
4ß01,331130 10454 025 05W 29 vsTC
fiANSON 2-983

301331136 10455 02S 03W 9 WSTC
BURDOCK2-3485
4301331132 10456 025 OSW 34 wsTC
LINDSAY 2-33Ah

01331141 10457 015 04W 33 WSTc
TE 2-31A2

4301331139 10458 ois 02W 31 wsTC
J£NKlN$ #2-1283

01331121 10459 02S 03w 12 wsTC

TOTAL

Comments (attach separate sheet if necessary)

I
, e reviewed this report and certify the information to be accurate and complete. Date

Authorized signature
Telephone

PLEASE COMPLETE FORMS IN BLACK



A D ANR Production Cornpany
a subsidiary of Th• Coastal Corporation

JAN25 1988

thWbl0NOF
O,L,GAS&h¾NING January 19, 1988

Natural Resources
Oil, Gas & Mining
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

Attention: Ms. Lisha Romero pgag

This letter includes the informatio you requested on January 12,
1988 concerning the recent merger of_ANWLimited, Inc. into ANR

N)ob 7E>d-Production Company. Effective December31, 1987 (December, 1987
Production), ANRLimited, Inc. merged into ANRProduction Company; and
henceforth, will continue operations as ANRProduction Company.

ANRProduction Companywill begin reporting and remitting the Utah
Conservation and Occupation Taxes effective December, 1987 production
for leases previously reported by ANR Limited, Inc. (Utah Account No.
N-7245). ANR Production Companywill use the new Utah Account No.
N-0675, as assigned by the State of Utah.

flease contact me at (713) 877-6167 if I can answer any questions
on this matter.

Very truly yours,

Manager, Crude evenue Accounting
CC ,AWS

CTE:mmw

/

Coastal Tower,'Nine Greenway Plaza, Houston, Texas 77046-0995 • (713)



orm L., E OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAARESOURCES 6. Lease Designation and Serial NumberDIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING Fee

7. Indian Allottee or Tribe Name

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/ADo not use mes form ter proposals to drill new wells, doepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned weits. 8. Unit or Communitization AgreementUse APPUCATION FOR PEAMIT-- for su

N/AType at Weit
9. Well Name and Numoern °wit, On Oo n.aspec

Hanson Trust #2-9832.Nameotoperator
10. API Well NumberANR Production Company

43-013-31136.LAddreasofOperator
Number 11. Field and Poot, or WildcatP. 0. Box 749, Denver, Colorado 80201-074 - MNG4476 Altamont5- Location of Weil

cootage 1461' FWL& 1531' FSL county : Duchesneoo. see, T.. a.. M. NFSW.Section 9, T2S-R3W State : UTAHm. CHECK ARPROPRIATEBOXES TO INDICATENATURE OENOTlCELREPORT OR OTHER DAT&NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)
Abandonment New Construction Abandonment • New ConstructionCasing Aepair Pull or Alter Casing O casingsepair Poil or Alter casingO enansaof Plans O accompletion O changeor Frans O Shoot or AcidizeConversion to iniection g Shoot or Acidize O conversionto injection O ventor FlareO scactureTreat O ventor mar• O Fracture Treat O Water Shut-OfMultipte Completion O watersnut-o" O OtherO other

Oate of Work CompletionApproximate Date Work Will Start 5/6/91
Report results of MultipleCompletions and Aecompletions to different reservoirson WELLCOMPLETION OR AECOMPLETIONANOLOG form.
* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12. DESCRISE PAOPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS(Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell is directionally drilled. give subsurfacelocadonaand measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Please see the attached procedure to add perforations and acidize the above-referenced well.

14. J hereby certify tha hh f g is true an rr ct

samassionature
e Regulatory Analystoat. 4-5-91

(State Use Only)

(8/907 See Instructions on Aeverse



WORKOVERPROCEDURE

Hanson 2-9B3
Altamont Field

Duchesne County, Utah

WELLDATA

Location: 1461' FWL& 1531' FSL
Elevation: 5950' KB, 5928' GL
Total Depth: 13,200' PBTD: 13,196'
Casing: 9-5/8", 36#, K-55 set @4000'

7", 26#, N-80 & P-110 set @10,400'
5", 18#, P-110 from 10,224'-13,200'

Tubing: 2-7/8", 6.5#, N-80, DSS-HT @ 10,166' with 7" tbg anchor
2-3/8", 4.7#, N-80 DSS-HTtubing @10,076'

Tubular Data:
Capacity Burst Collapse

Description ID Drift (B/F) (psi) (osi)
7" 26# N-80 6.276" 6.151" 0.0382 7240 5410
7" 26# P-110 6.276" 6.151" 0.0382 9960 6210
5" 18# P-110 4.276" 4.151" 0.0177 13940 13450

2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 2.441" 2.347" 0.00579 10570 11160

Present Status: Producing from Wasatch perforations 10,674'-13,104' on parallel free
hydraulic pump.

PROCEDURE

1. MIRU service rig. NDwellhead and BOP. POOHw/prod tubing, pump cavity and packer.

2. CO 5" liner to 13,196'.

3. Perforate Wasatch with 3 SPF using 3-1/8" casing gun as per attached schedule.

4. PU 5" packer on 2-7/8" x 3-1/2" tbg and TIH. Set packer @ ±10,300'.

5. Acidize perforations 10,647'-13,104' with 24,000 gals 15%HC1 w/1134 1.1 ball sealers
and other additives.
A. Precede acid with 250 bb1s water with 10 gal per 1000 scale inhibitor and 500 gal

Xylene.
B. All water to contain 3% KC1.
C. Acidize in 6 stages of 4000 gal each w/diverter stages of 1000 gal gelled

saltwater with 1/2#/gal each of Benzoic acid flakes and rock salt.
D. Acid to be pumped down 3-1/2" tbg at highest rate possible @8000 psi maximum.

6. Flow back acid immediately following pumping.

7. Unseat packer and POOHwith tubing and packer. Rerun production equipment.

8. Return well to production.



Perforation Schedule
Hanson Trust #2-983

SW/4 Section 9, T2S-R3W
Duchesne County, Utah
Greater Altamont Field

Depth Reference: Dresser DIFL-GR-CAL (2/23/86)

13031 12413 12125 11856 11375 11027 10697
13019 12404 12107 11843 11349 10950 10683
12926 12380 12093 11826 11318 10938 10666
12869 12376 12084 11788 11303 10913 10653
12853 12369 12077 11777 11296 10873 10647
12846 12350 12071 11769 11291 10847
12814 12337 12062 11745 11275 10842
12738 12325 12028 11558 11235 10836
12722 12287 12016 11528 11222 10799
12709 12279 12008 11523 11176 10794
12622 12266 11984 11502 11158 10772
12566 12240 11972 11493 11136 10766
12502 12215 11965 11484 11097 10751
12495 12199 11939 11418 11092 10734
12447 12172 11866 11398 11083 10726

Gross Wasatch Interval 10,647'-13,031'

95 feet, 76 zones

RJL
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Fo< a S'. OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAARESOURCES 6. Lease oesignationand serialNumeer
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING Fee

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPO N/Ao not use this form for proposais todriifnew welisedeepen existing wells; or to plugged and aban on ts. 8. Unit or Communitization Agreement
Use48PtlCATION EORPERMIT-for such pr sais

JtR2 8 1991 N/Aype at Weli
9. Yeti Name ana Numoer

it SeÏ¡ Other spec
DMSION OF Hanson Trust #2-9B32.s...atop.r.'°'

OILGAS&MINING '°·^"**"""""*'ANR Production Company 43-013-31136
LAddressofQperator

4. Telephone Number 11. Held and Poof, or WildcatP. O. Box 749, Denver, Colorado 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Altamont/Bluebell5- Location of Well

Footage : 1461' FWL & 1531' FSL county : Duchesneao. sec. T.. R.. M. : NESW, Section 9, T2S-R3W state : UTAH
02. CHECKAPPROPRIATEBOXES TO INDICATENATUREOFNOTlCEL.REPGAT OROTHER OAŒANOTICEOF 1NTENT SUBSEQUENT REPOAT(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

Abandonment New Construc:ion Abandonment ' New ConstructionCasing Repair Pull or Alter Casing Casing Aepair Pull or Alter CasingO enangeor Pia"3 O accompletion O Change of Plans g Shoot of AcidizeConversion to injection O t or^cidize O conversionto infection O ventor mareO Practure Treat O ventor mar• O Fracture Treat O watersaut-onMultipte Completion O Water Shut-OH Other
Other

Date of Work Completion 6/1/91
Approximate Date Work Will Start

Aeport resultsof Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirson WELLCOMPLETloN CA RECOMPLETIONANDLOG torm.
* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12.DESCRISE PACPOSED CA COMPLETEDOPERAT10NS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell is directionally drilled, give subsurfacelocationaand measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Please see the attached chronological history for the perf and acid job performedon the above-referenced well.

14. i hereby certify that oing is tru correct

Name & Signature
tie Regulatory Analyst cat• 6 /26 /91(State Use Only)

(8190† See instructions on Aeverse



lill IIII

THE COASTALCORPORATION
PRODUCTIONREPORT

CHRONOLOGICALHISTORY
HANSON#2-9B3 (PERF & ACIDIZE) Page 3ALTAMONT/BLUEBELLFIELD
DUCHESNECOUNTY,UTAH
WI: 61.81% ANR AFE: 63478

5/26/91 F1wd 60 BO, 35 BW, 104 MCF/24 hrs, FTP 80#.
5/27/91 F1wd 65 80, 85 BW, 90 MCF/24hrs, FTP 50#. Will place well back onpump.

5/28/91 F1wd 68 BO, 32 BW, 102 MCF/24 hrs, FTP 100#, 18/64" chk. WOrig toplace well on pump.

5/29/91 Prep to POOHw/tbg. MIRUservice rig. Flwd 74 BO, 77 BW, 117 MCF/24hrs, FTP 150#, 18/64" chk.
DC: $257 TC: $110,477

5/30/91 POHw/pkr, prep to run hyd pump BHA. NU 80P's. POHw/2-3/8" tbg.Rel 5" pkr & POOHw/2-7/8" tbg.
DC: $5,746 TC: $116,223

5/31-6/1/9,1 Well on hydraulic pump. Fin POHw/5" pkr. RIH w/hyd pump cavityand tbg anchor on 2-7/8" tbg. Set anchor @10,188' w/cavity @9838'.Place well on pump 5:30 p.m., 6/1/91.
DC: $6,521 TC: $122,744

6/1/91 Pmpd 356 80, 289 BW, 270 MCF/13 hrs, PP 1400#.
6/2/91 Pmpd 860 80, 746 BW, 647 MCF/24 hrs, PP 1500#.
6/3/91 Pmpd 705 BO, 605 BW, 845 MCF/24 hrs, PP 1800#.
6/4/91 Pmpd 527 BO, 446 BW, 734 McF/20 hrs, PP 1800#. Down 4 hrs - installcheck valve.

DC: $5,556 TC: $128,300
6/5/91 Pmpd 598 80, 530 BW, 857 MCF/24 hrs.

Prior prod: 40 80, 252 BW, 429 MCF. Final



FORM 9 TATE OF UTAH
DIVISIO OIL, GAS AND MINING

5. Lease Designation and Serial Number:

See Attached
6. If indian, Allotteeor Tribe Name:SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS SeeAttached

Do not use thisform for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wels. 7. Unit Agreement Name:
Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLOR DEEPEN form for such proposals. See Attached

1. Type of Well:
8. Well Name and Number:

OIL GAS OTHER: See Attached
2. Name of Operator:

9. API Well Number:
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation See Attached

3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Widcat:
P.O. Box749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455 See Attached

4. Location of Well

Footages: See Attached county: See Attached
QQ, Sec., To R., M.: See Attached state: Utah

. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT

(Submit in Dig>Iicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

Abandon New Construction Abandon * New Construction
Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing
Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans Perforate
Convert to injection Perforate Convert to Injection Vent or Flare
Fracture Treat or Acidize Vent or Flare Fracture Treat or Acidize Water Shut-Off
Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off Other Change of Operator
Other

Date of work completion

Approximate date work willstart Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompans to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETIONREPORT AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cementverification report.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state aff pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwellis directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and trueverticaldepths for all markers and zones pertinent to thiswork.)

Please be advised that effective December 27, 1995,ANR Production Company relinquished and Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation
assumed operations for the subject wells (see attached). Bond coverage pursuant to 43 CFR 3104 for lease activities is being
provided by Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation under the following bonds: State of Utah #102103, BLM Nationwide Bond#U605382-9, and BIA Nationwide Bond #11-40-66A. Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation, as operator, agrees to be responsible
under the terms and conditions of the leases for the operations conducted upon leased lands.

B nie Carson, Sr. Environmental & Safety Analyst
ANR Production Company V OF O L, GAS & MININ

2. Sheila Bremer
Environmental & Safety Analyst

Name & Signature: TIlle: Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation oate: 03/07/96

(This space for State use only)

(5/94) (See Instructions on Reverse



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
OPERATORCHANGEHORKSHEET "°"

1
Attach all documentation received by the division regarding this change. 2 ILE
Initial each listed item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable. . 3

4
Change of Operator (well sold) O Designation of Agent 5 ,

Designation of Operator O Operator Name Change Only 62

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed (EFFECTIVE DATE: 12-27-95

TO (new operator) COASTAL DIL & GAS CORP FROM (former operator) ANR PRODUCTION CO INC
(address) Po BoX 749 (address) Po Box 749

DENVER CO 80201-0749 DENVER CO 80201-0749

phone (303 )572-1121 phone (303 )572-1121
account no. N 0230(B) account no. NO675

Hell(s) (attach additional page if needed)

Name:**SEE ATTACHED** API:Q ~3] Q Entity: Sec Twp Rng Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec_ Twp _ Rng_

_ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec Twp _Rng_ _ Lease Type:
Name: APT: Entity: Sec _ Twp _ Rng Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec Twp _ Rng_ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec _ Twp Rng_ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec _Twp _ Rng_ Lease Type:

0 RATORCHANGEDOCUMENTA

u dry or other
_1_egg documentation has been received from formeroperator (Attach to this form)./h)/pg,g)

2. (Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or ther legal documentation has been received from nay operator
(Attach to this form). M. 3-2-f

NÁ4_3. The Department of Commerce has been contacted if the new operator above is not currently
operating any wells in Utah. Is company registered with the state? (yes/no) If
yes, show compan'y file number: .

Ñ/A4. (For Indian and Federal Hells ONLY) The BLM has been contacted regarding this change
(attach Telephone Documentation Form to this report). Make note of BLM status in
comments section of this form. Management review of Federal and Indian well operator
changes should take place prior to completion of steps 5 through 9 below.

5. Changes have been qtered in the.011apd Gas nformatipn System (Wang/IBM) for each well
l i sted above. fa-//-fá/dafŠk la//f/5-U/pag's (f-2o4Áfyd/ MO

6. Cardex file has been updated for each well listed above.

LT. Well file labels have been updated-for each well listed above.

8. Changes have been included on the monthly "Operator, Address, and Account Changes" mema
for .distribution to State Lands and the Tax Commission. (g Lý

9. A folder has been set up for the Operator Change file, and a copy of this page has been
placed there for reference during routing and processing of the original documents.

- OVER



IIþ (Iþ
OPERATOR CHANGEWORKSHEET(CONTINUED) Initial each item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable.

ENTITY RREU eEHR615-8-7)

Entity assi ments have been reviewed for all wells listed above. Were
entity changes made? (yes/ ___ (If entity assignments were changed, attach co_Ries of
Form 6, Entity Action FormT.

/ 2. State Lands and the Tax Commission have been notified through normal procedures of
entity changes.

BOpD VERIFICATION (Fee wells only) " |
} 1. (Rule R615-3-1) The new operator of any fee lease well listed above has furnished a

proper bond.

2. A copy of this form has been placed in the new and former operators' bond files.

3. The former operator Tas requested a release of liability from their bond (yes p) __ .

Today's date hverc //, 19_2 . If yes, division response was made by letter
dated 19-· (sle Ña»ÁuÓ¾

LEASE INTEREST OHNER NOTIFICATION RESPONSIBILITY

1. CRule R615-2-10) The former operator/lessee of any fee lease well listed above has been
notified by letter dated 19___, of their responsibility to notify any
person with an interest in such lease of the change of operator. Documentation of such
notification has been requested.

2. Copies of documents have been sent to State Lands for changes involving State leases.

FILMING ,

1. All attachments to this form have been microfilmed. Date:
19c 7

FILING

1. Copies of all attachments to this form have been filed in each well file.

2. The oEiginal of this form and the original attachments have been filed in the Operator
Change file.



CHANGE OF OPERATOR - From ANR Production Co. To Coastal Oil &Gas Corp. 03/07/96 - Page 2 of 4

If Indian, LOCATIONCF WELL
Lease Designation Allottee or Section, Township

We/I Name &No. API No. & Serial Number Tribe Name CA No. Footages & Range Field County

Brotherson 1-33A4 43-013-30272 Patented _ gpg0 N/A N/A 820' FNL &660' FEL NENE, 33-1S-4W Altamont Duchesni
Brotherson 2-10B4 43-013-30443 Patented jlpjf N/A N/A 1241' FSL & 1364' FWL SESW, 10-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne
Brotherson 2-14B4 43-013-30815 Fee j09§Ð N/A N/A 2557' FSL & 1642' FWL NESW, 14-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne
Brotherson 2-15B4 43-013-31103 Fee ) 7 N/A N/A 996' FWL & 1069' FSL SWSW, 15-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne
Brotherson 2-22B4 43-013-31086 Fee | N/A N/A 1616' FWL & 1533' FSL NESW, 22-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne
Brotherson 2-2B5 43-013-31302 Fee //3 N/A N/A 1034' FSL & 2464' FEL SWSE, 2-2S-5W Altamont Duchesne
Christensen 2-29A4 43-013-31303 Fee _//235 N/A N/A 1425' FSL &2131' FEL NWSE, 29-1S-4W Altamont Duchesne
Crook 1-6B4 43-013-30213 Patented ¡g;2g N/A N/A 2485' FNL & 1203' FEL SENE, 6-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne
Dastrup 2-30A3 43-013-31320 Fee || N/A N/A 1250' FSL & 1229' FWL SWSW, 30-1S-3W Altamont Duchesne
Doyle 1-10B3 43-013-30187 Patented b N/A N/A 2382' FNL &2157' FWL SENW, 10-2S3W Bluebell Duchesne
Duncan 2-9B5 43-013-30719 Fee N/A N/A 1701' FWL & 1554' FSL NESW, 9-2S-5W Altamont Duchesne
Ehrich 3-11B5 43-013-31080 Fee N/A N/A 1654' FSL & 1754' FWL NESW, 11-2S-5W Altamont Duchesne
Elder 1-13B2 43-013-30366 Patented N/A N/A 1490' FNL & 1334' FEL SWNE, 13-2S-2W Bluebell Duchesne
Ellsworth 1-17B4 43-013-30126 Patented †ß N/A N/A 763' FNL & 1189' FEL NENE, 17-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne
Ellsworth 1-19B4 43-013-30183 Patented _ '/pg N/A N/A 2043' FNL & 1764' FEL SWNE, 19-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne
Ellsworth 1-20B4 43-013-30351 Patented _ çO N/A N/A 1744' FNL & 1342' FEL SWNE, 20-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne
Ellsworth 1-8B4 43-013-30112 Fee NIA N/A 1755' FNL & 2377' FEL SWNE, 8-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne
Ellsworth 2-17B4 43-013-31089 Fee | N/A N/A 1355' FWL& 1362' FSL NESW, 17-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne
Ellsworth 2-19B4 43-013-31105 Fee | | N/A N/A 1402' FSL & 1810' FWL NESW, 19 -2S-4W Altamont Duchesne
Ellsworth 2-20B4

¯
43-013-31090 Fee | DR. N/A N/A 677' FWL & 1611' FSL NWSW, 20-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne

Ellsworth 3-20B4 43-013-31389 Fee N/A N/A 1500' FNL& 1203' FWL SWNW, 20-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne
Farnsworth 1-12B5 43-013-2‡924 Sol2 Patented /b N/A N/A 2479' FNL & 1503' FEL SWNE, 12-2S-5W Altamont Duchesne
Farnsworth 1-13B5 43-013-30092 Patented ¡Q N/A N/A 670' FNL & 1520' FEL NWNE, 13-2S-5W Altamont Duchesne
Farnsworth 1-7B4 43-013-30097 Patented 0 N/A N/A 1923' FNL & 1095' FEL SENE, 7-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne
Farnsworth 2-12B5 43-013-31115 Fee /, N/A N/A 993' FSL Ï 768' FWL ŠŸVSW, 12-2S-5W Altamont Duchesne
Farnsworth 2-7B4 43-013-30470 Patented 5 N/A N/A 1292' FSL & 1500' FWL SESW, 7-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne
Fieldstead 2-28A4 43-013-31293 Fee // N/A N/A 2431' FS_L_&2212' FWL NESW, 28-1S-4W Altamont Duchesne
Gal\oway 1-18B1 43-013-30575 Fee 2'<lr5 N/A N/A 1519' FNL & 1565' FEL SWNE, 18-2S-1W Bluebell Duchesne
Hanskutt 2-23B5 43-013-30917 Fee 'f&m N/A N/A 951' FSL & 761' FWL SWSW, 23-2S-5W Altamont Duchesne
Hanson 1-24B3 43-013-30629 Fee 2370 N/A _ N/A 1354' FNL & 1540' FWL NENW,24-2S-3W Bluebell Duchesne
Hanson 2-9B3 43-013-31136 Fee /0 N/A N/A 1461' FWL& 1531' FSL NESW, 9-2S-3W Altamont Duchesne
Hanson Trust 1-32A3 43-013-30141 Patented | N/A N/A 671' FNL& 1710' FEL NWNE,32-1S-3W Altamont Duchesne
Hanson Trust 1-5B3 43-013-30109 Patented

, 3§ N/A N/A 1200' FNL & 1140' FWL NENE, 5-2S-3W Altamont Duchesne
Hanson Trust 2-29A3 43-013-31043 Fee jo N/A N/A 1857' FWL & 1394' FSL NESW, 29-1S-3W Altamont Duchesne
Hanson Trust 2-32A3 43-013-31072 Fee j .

N/A N/A 1141' FWL & 1602' FSL NWSW, 32-1S-3W Altamont Duchesne
Hanson Trust 2-5B3 43-013-31079 Fee N/A N/A 1606' FSL & 1482' FWL NESW, 5-2S-3W Altamont Duchesne
Hartman 1-31A3 43-013-30093 Fee § N/A _ N/A 1019' FNL& 1024' FEL NENE, 31-1S-3W Altamont Duchesne
Hartman 2-31A3 43-013-31243 Fee N/A N/A 243T FSL & 1505' FWL SWSW, 31-1S-3W Altamont Duchesne
Hunt 1-21B4 43-013-30214 Patented / O N/A N/A 1701' FNL&782' FEL SENE, 21-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne
Hunt 2-21B4 43-013-31114 Fee N/A N/A 1512' FWL &664' FSL NESW, 21-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne
lorg 2-10B3 43-013-31388 Fee | N/A N/A 738' FNL_&660' FEL NENE, 10-2S-3W Altamont Duchesne
Lake Fork 3-15B4 43-013-31358 Fee | 3 N/A N/A 1300' FNL & 1450' FWL NENW, 15-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne
Lawrence 1-30B4 43-013-30220 Fee | N/A N/A 919' FNL& 1622' FEL NWNE, 30-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne
Lawson 1-28A1 43-013-30358 Fee N/A N/A 2275' FSL & 1802' FEL NWSE, 28-1S-1W Bluebell Duchesne
Lazy K2-14B3 43-013-31354 Fee j 2 N/A N/A 1670' FSL & 1488' FEL NWSE, 14-2S-3W Bluebell Duchesne
:Lindsay 2-33A4 43-013-31141 Fee jg N/A N/A 1499' FWL&663' FSL SESW, 33-1S-4W Altamont Duchesne
Lotridge Gates 1-3B3 43-013-30117 Patented

.

N/A N/A 965' FNL&750' FEL NENE, 3-2S-3W Altamont Duchesne
Matthews 2-13B2 43-013-31357 Fee N/A N/A 858' FNL &1098'FWL NWNW,13-2S-2W Bluebell Duchesne
Meeks 3-8B3 43-013-31377 Fee N/A N/A 1065' FNL& 1124' FWL NWNW,8-2S-3W Altamont



O O
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING S. LEASEDES1GNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
R. IFINDIAN.ALLOTTEEORTRIBEN^ME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drift new wells, significantly deepen exisling wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposais.

1. TYPE OF WELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL O OTHER

8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

Exhibit "A"
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMOER: 10. FIELO AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

A South 1200 East cny Vernal STATEUtahzie84078 435-789-4433
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O AClDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will stad: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANO ABANDON VENTOR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Dale of wod< completion:

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER: Name Change
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12- DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dales, depths, volumes, etc.

As a result of the merger between The Coastal Corporation and a wholly owned

subsidary of El Paso Energy Corporation, the name of Coastal. Oil & Gas Corporation

has been changed to El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company effective March 9, 2001.

See Exhibit "A"

Bond # l+00JUO708

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation
NAME(PLEASEPRINT Ohn T r TITLE ŸiC€ PreSident

SIGNATURE DATE ' 'O

El Paso duction Oil & Gas C nïpäiiÿ
NAME(PLEASEPRI( ) John T er TITLE

Vice President

SIGNATURE ___ DATE '

(This space for ate use only RE EIVED
JUN ¾9 2001

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DIVISIONOF
OIL, GAS AND



State of Delaware

Office of the Secretary of State
PAGE 1

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF

DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATTACHED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT

COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT OF "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION", CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION" TO "EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY", FILED IN

THIS OFFICE ON THE NINTH DAY OF MARCH, A.D. 2001, AT 11 O'CLOCK

A.M.

RECElvED

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND MINING

Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary of State

0610204 8100 AUTHENTICATION: 1061007

010162788 DATE:



· e O
003/00303/09/01 10:14 FAX 713 420 4099 CORP. LAW DEPT.

CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT

OF

CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION (the "Company"), a corporationorganized and existing under and by virtue of the General Corporation Law of the State ofDelaware. DOES HEREBY CERTIFY:

FIRST: That the Board of Directors of the Company, by the unanimouswritten consent of its members, filed with the minutes of the Board, adopted a resolutionproposing and declaring advisable the foHowing amendment to the Certificate ofIncorporation of the Company:

RESOLVED that it is deemed advisable that the Certificate ofIncorporation of this Company be amended, and that said Certificate ofIncorporationbe so amended, by changing the Article thereof numbered"FIRST." so that, as amended, said Article shall be and read as follows;

"FTRST. The narne of the corporation is El Paso Production Oil & Gas
Company."

SECOND: That in lieu of a meeting and vote of stockholders, thestockholders entitled to vote have given unanimous written consent to said amendment inaccordance with the provisions of Section 228 of the General Corporation Law of theState of Delaware.

THIRD: That the aforesaid amendment was duly adopted in accordance withthe applicable provisions of Sections 242 and 228 of the General CorporationLaw of theState of Delaware.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, said COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATIONhas caused this certificate to be signed on its behalf by a Vice Presidentand attested by anAssistant Secretary, this 9th day of March 2001.

COASTALOIL& GAS CORPORATION

David L. Siddall
Vice PresidentAttest:

STATE OF DELANARE
SECRETARY OF STATE

M DIVISION OF CORPORATIONSet E. Ro si t Secrete A ElVE TILED 11:00 AN 03/09/2001
010118394 - 0610204

JUN19 2001
DIVISION OF

OIL, GAS AND



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH 4-KAS

2. CDW 5-LIV
3. JLT 6-FILE

Enter date after each listed item is completed

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent

Operator Name Change (Only) X Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 3-09-2001

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY
Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 RM 2975B

HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995 HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995

Phone: 1-(713)-418-4635 Phone: 1-(832)-676-4721

Account NO230 Account N1845

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)

API ENTITY SEC TWN LEASE WELL WELL
NAME NO NO RNG TYPE TYPE STATUS
MILES 2-3B3 43-013-31261 11102 03-02S-03W FEE OW P
RUST 1-4B3 43-013-30063 1575 04-02S-03W FEE OW P
RUST 3-4B3 43-013-31070 1576 04-02S-03W FEE OW P
HANSON TRUST 1-5B3 43-013-30109 1635 05-02S-03W FEE OW P
HANSON TRUST 2-5B3 43-013-31079 1636 05-02S-03W FEE OW P
CHRISTENSEN 2-8B3 43-013-30780 9355 08-02S-03W FEE OW P
MEEKS 3-8B3 43-013-31377 11489 08-02S-03W FEE OW P
flAÑßON 2-9B3 43-013-31136 10455 09-02S-03W FEE OW P
DOYLE 1-10B3 43-013-30187 1810 10-02S-03W FEE OW P
IORG 2-10B3 43-013-31388 11482 10-02S-03W FEE OW P
RUDY 1-11B3 43-013-30204 1820 11-02S-03W FEE OW P
LAZY K 2-11B3 43-013-31352 11362 11-02S-03W FEE OW P
JENKINS 2-12B3 (CA 96-79) 43-013-31121 10459 12-02S-03W FEE OW P
FLYING DIAMOND ROPER 1-14B3 43-013-30217 1850 14-02S-03W FEE OW P
LAZY K 2-14B3 43-013-31354 11452 14-02S-03W FEE OW P
BODRERO 1-15B3 43-013-30565 2360 15-02S-03W FEE OW S
LINMAR HANSON 1-16B3 43-013-30617 9124 16-02S-03W FEE OW P
EVANS UTE 2-17B3 (CA 96-104) 43-013-31056 5336 17-02S-03W FEE OW P
MYRIN 2-18B3 (CA 70814) 43-013-31297 11475 18-02S-03W FEE OW P
EVANS 1-19B3 (CA 96-78) 43-013-30265 1776 19-02S-03W FEE OW P

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 06/19/2001

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 06/19/2001
3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 06/21/2001

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number:



5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on: N/A

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: N/A

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator
for wells listed on: N/A

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,

for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 07/03/2001

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 07/03/2001

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 06/20/2001

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 07/03/2001

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed has furnished a bond: 400JUO708

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE

FILMING:
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on: * /geOf

FILING:
1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:

COMMENTS: Master list of all wells involved in operator change from Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation to El Paso
Production Oil and Gas Company shall be retained in the "Operator Change



p e
Form 9 STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVlSION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 6. Lease Designation and Serial Number

FEE
7. Indian Allottee or Tribe Name

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Donotuse thisformforproposalstodrillnewwells,deepen existingwells,or toreenterpluggedand abandonedwells. 8. Unit or Communitization Agreement

UseAPPLICATIONFORPERMlT-for such proposals

1. Type of Well 9. Well Name and Number

11 el Other (specify) Hanson Trust #2-9B3
2. Name of Operator 10. API Well Number

El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company 43-013-31136
3. Address of Operator 4. Telephone Number 11. Field and Pool, or Wildcat

P.O. Box 1148 Vernal, Utah 84078 | (435) 781-7024 Altamont
5. Location of Well

Footage : 1531'FSL & 1461'FWL County : Duchesne
QQ, Sec, T., R., M. : NESW Section 9-T2S-R3W state : Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE MATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT

(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

Abandonment New Construction Abandonment * New Construction

Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing

Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans Shoot or Acidize

Conversion to Injection Shoot or Acidize Conversion to injection Vent or Flare

Fracture Treat Vent or Flare Fracture Treat Water Shut-Off

Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off Other Backside Acid Job

Other

Date of Work Completion 5/15/02
Approximate Date Work Will Start

Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs
on WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form.
* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

13. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface
locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Pmp 10 Bbls 2% KCL & 2 GL DP61 followed by 1900 GL 15% HCL Flush to top perf w/261 Bbls 2% KCL
water, in order to increase production.

ml hereb9yæcerffythat the foregoinch is t o

Title Regulatory Analyst Date 06/27/02

(State Use



Su E OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7 UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do not use thisform for proposals to drillnewwells, significantlydeepen existing wells below cunentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or lo

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER S -

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY 4301331136
3, ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1339 EL SEGUNDO NE c17Y
ALBUQUERQUE

STATE NM ZIP 87113 (505) 344-9380 ALTAMONT
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1537 FSL, 1467 FWL couart DUCHESNE

QTRKITR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:NESW 9 2S 3W STATE:
UTAH

n. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICEOF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximate date workwillArt CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCRON TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only}

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofworkcompletion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOFWELLSITE GTHER: ROD PUMP
6/23/2004

CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION CONVERSION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

6/18/04 - 6/2/304

RIH W/ 2 3/8" 8RD SOLID PLUG, 1 JT 2 3/8" 8RD TBG, 1 - 3 1/2" PBGA, 1- 4'X 2 3/8" 8 RD PUP JT, 1 - 2 3/8" 8RD + 45 SN,
7 JTS 2 3/8" 8RD TBG, 1 - 5" TAC, 38 JTS 2 3/8" TBG, X-0, 320 JTS 2 7/8" DSS HT TBG, X-0. SET TAC@ 11,360' WI
20,000# TENSION. FLUSHTBG W/ 65 BBLS X-0 FI RODS. RIH WI 2" X 1 1/4" 36' RHBD PUMP &80 3/4" RODS. RIHWI
115 RODS, 141 - 7/8" RODS, 124 - 1", 1 - 4' X 1" PONY, 1 1/2" X 36' POLISH ROD, SEAT PUMP @ 11,592'. SPACE OUT
PUMP. FILL TBG WI45 BBLS PT 1000#. STROKE TEST 800#. SLIDE ROTO FLEXUNITINPLACE.

PLACE WELLON PRODUCTION.

NAME(PL INT) CHERYLCAMERON TITLE C. REGULATORYANALYST

SIGNATU .QMyt DATE 8/25/2004

(This space for State use only)

RECEiVED
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) AUS2 / 2004

DIVOFOIL,GAS&



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 HANSON 2-9B3 R 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43013311360000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1531 FSL 1461 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 09 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

11/14/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 El Paso plans to perforate the LGR and acidize. Please see attached procedure
for more detail.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038

TITLE
 Sr. Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 10/5/2011

10/12/2011

Oct. 05, 2011

Sundry Number: 19194 API Well Number: 43013311360000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEEEASEDESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well HANSON 2-9B3 R

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP 43013311360000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 E×t ALTAMONT

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1531 FSL 1461 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 09 Township: 02.05 Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

11/14/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

El Paso plans to perforate the LGR and acidize. Please see attached procedure
for more detail.

Approved by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: 10/12/2 1

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Sr. Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



Hanson 2-9B3 Procedure Summary 

• POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing 

• Circulate & Clean wellbore 

• Perforate new intervals in the Lower Green River from (9,922’-10,625’) 

• Acidize new and existing perforations with 45,000 gals of 15% HCL in three separate 
stages using retrievable bridge plugs 

• RIH w/BHA, tubing, pump, and rods 

• Clean location and resume production 

Oct. 05, 2011

Sundry Number: 19194 API Well Number: 43013311360000

Hanson 2-9B3 Procedure Summary
• POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing
• Circulate & Clean wellbore
• Perforate new intervals in the Lower Green River from (9,922'-10,625')
• Acidize new and existing perforations with 45,000 gals of 15% HCL in three separate

stages using retrievable bridge plugs
• RIH w/BHA, tubing, pump, and rods

• Clean location and resume



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 HANSON 2-9B3 R 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43013311360000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1531 FSL 1461 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 09 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

11/10/2011

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Please see attached Operations Summary for details.  

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038

TITLE
 Principle Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 12/9/2011

12/12/2011

Dec. 09, 2011

Sundry Number: 21138 API Well Number: 43013311360000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well HANSON 2-9B3 R

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP 43013311360000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 E×t ALTAMONT

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1531 FSL 1461 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 09 Township: 02.05 Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

11/10/2011 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR RErt
D e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached Operations Summary for details.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Principle Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



WESTERN

1       General

1.1       Customer Information

WESTERNCompany

Representative

Address

1.2       Well Information

HANSON 2-9B3RWell

HANSON 2-9B3RSiteALTAMONT FIELDProject

Event RECOMPLETE LANDPEAK/700 *Rig Name/No.

Start Date 10/31/2011 End Date

12/18/1985Spud Date UWI 009-002-S 003-W 30

Active Datum Kelly Bushing @5,950.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)

Afe 

No./Description

155728/44010 / HANSON 2-9 B3-R

2       Summary

2.1       Operation Summary

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

11/1/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 MIRU 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TOOH W/ RODS 

FILLED OUT JSA.

 7:30 10:00 2.50 MIRU 01 P SLID ROTA-FLEX, MIRU RIG WHILE PUMPING 60 BBLS DOWN 

CSG.

10:00 11:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P UNSEAT PUMP FLUSH TBG W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL.

11:00 14:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 118-1", 117-7/8 (LD 5-7/8 ROD WEAR) 140-3/4,24-1" 

AND 2 1/2" X 1 1/2" X 36' PUMP

14:00 16:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 16 P ND WELLHEAD NU BOPS.RELEASED TAC.

16:30 18:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 102 JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. EOT @ 6988'.SECURED 

WELL SDFN.

11/2/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P  CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY ON TRIPPING TUBGING AND 

TUBING TONGS FILLED OUT JSA.

 7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P CONTINUED TOOH W/ 205 JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUETBG, 7" TAC, 

6-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUETBG, SN, 6' TBG SUB, 4 1/2 PBGA, 1-JT 2 

7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, SOLID PLUG AND 5 3/4" NO-GO.

10:30 15:30 5.00 WBP 39 TALLIED AND RIH W/ 6 1/8" BIT,SCRAPER, X-OVER AND 318 

JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. TAGGED LINER @ 12210' 8' IN ON JT # 

318.

15:30 18:00 2.50 WBP 39 TOOH W/ 120- JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. EOT @6332' SECURED 

WELL SDFN

11/3/2011  6:30  7:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL, HELD SAFETY MTNG (TRIPPING TUBING). 

WRITE & REVIEW JSA'S.

 7:00  9:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 198 JNTS 2 7/8" EUE TBNG. L/D X-O SUB. 7" 

SCRAPPER. 6 1/8" RB. CHANGE OVER TO 2 3/8" TBNG 

EQUIPMENT.

 9:30 14:30 5.00 PRDHEQ 39 P P/U 4 1/8" RB. 5" SCRAPPER. X-O SUB. RIH P/U 33 JNTS 2 3/8" 

N-80 EUE TBNG. X-O 2 3/8" EUE X 2 7/8" EUE. 5 3/4" NO-GO. RIH 

OUT OF DERRICK W/ 318 JNTS 2 7/8" N-80 EUE TBNG TO 

11,292'. SPOT IN PIPE RACKS. UNLOAD 331 JNTS 3 1/2" TBNG.

14:30 15:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P R/U HOT OILER. FLUSH TBNG W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL WTR. @220 

DEG.

15:30 18:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 220 JNTS 2 7/8" N-80 EUE TBNG. EOT @4,296'. 

SECURE WELL S.D.F.N.

11/4/2011

 1December 09, 2011 at 12:42 pm OpenWells  Dec. 09, 2011

Sundry Number: 21138 API Well Number: 43013311360000

WESTERN

1 General

1.1 Customer Information

Companv WESTERN

Representative

Address

1.2 Well Information

Well HANSON 2-9B3R

Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site HANSON 2-9B3R

Rig Name/No. PEAKl700 * Event RECOMPLETE LAND

Start Date 10/31/2011 End Date
Spud Date 12/18/1985 UWI 009-002-5 003-W 30

Active Datum Kelly Bushing @5,950.0ft(above Mean Sea Level)

Afe 155728/44010 / HANSON 2-9 B3-R

No.lDescription

2 Summary

2.1 Operation Summary

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)

11/1/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 MIRU 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TOOH WI RODS
FILLED OUT JSA.

7:30 10:00 2.50 MIRU 01 P SLID ROTA-FLEX, MIRU RIG WHILE PUMPING 60 BBLS DOWN
CSG.

10:00 11:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P UNSEAT PUMP FLUSH TBG W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL.
11:00 14:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH WI118-1", 117-7/8 (LD 5-7/8 ROD WEAR) 140-3/4,24-1"

AND 2 1/2" X 1 1/2" X 36' PUMP
14:00 16:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 16 P ND WELLHEAD NU BOPS.RELEASED TAC.
16:30 18:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 102 JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. EOT @ 6988'.SECURED

WELL SDFN.
11/2/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY ON TRIPPING TUBGING AND

TUBING TONGS FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P CONTINUED TOOH W/ 205 JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUETBG, 7" TAC,

6-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUETBG, SN, 6' TBG SUB, 4 1/2 PBGA, 1-JT 2
7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, SOLID PLUG AND 5 3/4" NO-GO.

10:30 15:30 5.00 WBP 39 TALLIED AND RIH W/ 6 1/8" BIT,SCRAPER, X-OVER AND 318
JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. TAGGED LINER @ 12210' 8' IN ON JT #
318.

15:30 18:00 2.50 WBP 39 TOOH W/ 120- JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. EOT @6332'SECURED
WELL SDFN

11/3/2011 6:30 7:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL, HELD SAFETY MTNG (TRIPPING TUBING).
WRITE & REVIEW JSA'S.

7:00 9:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 198 JNTS 2 7/8" EUE TBNG. L/D X-O SUB. 7"
SCRAPPER. 6 1/8" RB. CHANGE OVER TO 2 3/8" TBNG
EQUIPMENT.

9:30 14:30 5.00 PRDHEQ 39 P P/U 4 1/8" RB. 5" SCRAPPER.X-O SUB. RIH P/U 33 JNTS 2 3/8"
N-80 EUE TBNG. X-O 2 3/8" EUE X 2 7/8" EUE. 5 3/4" NO-GO. RIH
OUT OF DERRICK W/ 318 JNTS 2 7/8" N-80 EUE TBNG TO
11,292'. SPOT IN PIPE RACKS. UNLOAD 331 JNTS 3 1/2" TBNG.

14:30 15:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P RIU HOT OILER. FLUSH TBNG W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL WTR. @220
DEG.

15:30 18:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 220 JNTS 2 7/8" N-80 EUE TBNG. EOT @4,296'.
SECURE WELL S.D.F.N.

11/4/2011

December 09, 2011 at 12:42 pm 1



WESTERN

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

 6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETIN ON WIRELINE SAFETY 

FILLED OUT JSA.

 7:30  9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 98-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER, 33-JTS 2 3/8 

N-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER, 5 " SCRAPER & 4 1/8" BIT.

 9:00 11:00 2.00 CHLOG 22 P RU WIRELINE RIH W/ GR/CCL LOGGED FROM 10700' TO 9850'.

11:00 12:30 1.50 WHDTRE 09 P CHANGED OUT CSG VALVES ON B SECTIONOF WELLHEAD.

12:30 17:30 5.00 STG01 21 P RIH PERFORATED FROM 10625 TO 9922' 387 HOLES USING 3 

1/8 120 DEGREE PHASING 22.7 GM SHOTS, 6 RUNS WHILE 

PUM[PING 352 BBLS DOWN CSG LAST RU FLUID LEVEL @ 

7545'. PERFS PICKED FROM DUAL INDUCTION FOCUSED LOG 

DATED 2/27/1986. CORRELATED TO PIONEER CCL/ GR LOG 

DATED 11-3-2011. SECURED WELL SDFN.

11/5/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON PICKING UP TUBING 

AND OVER HEAD HAZARDS.

 7:30 16:30 9.00 WBP 24 P TALLIED AND PU 5" PLUG, RH, 4' 2 7/8 N-80 TBG SUB, 5" PKR, 

34-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER, 321-JTS 3 1/2 P-110 EUE 

TBG. SET PLUG 14' OUT ON JT # 321 @ 11200'. TOOH W/ 

22-JTS 3 1/2 SET PKR @ 10637'

16:30 20:30 4.00 STG01 35 P RU PUMP TRUCKS. PUMPED STAGE 1 PUMMPED 7500 GALS 

15% HCL ACID W/ 192 BIO-BALLS THAN PUMPED 8000GALS 15 

% HCL ACID. AVG RATE 13.8, MAX RATE 15.9, AVG PRESS 

6499, MAX PRESS 6946. ISIP 2362, 5 MIN 1507 PSI, 10 MIN 1032, 

15 MIN 671 PSI, 30 MIN 200.45 MIN 0 PSI RELEASED PKR 

SECURED WELL SDFN.

11/6/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 STG02 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TBG W/ 

PKR AND PLUG FILLED OUT JSA

 7:30  9:00 1.50 STG02 39 P TIH W/  3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG. ENGAGED PLUG 11200' 

RELEASED PLUG. SET PLUG @10630' 15' OUT ON JT # 303. SET 

PKR @ 10248' 8' OUT JT # 291.

 9:00 11:00 2.00 STG02 35 P RU ACIDIZERS. FILLED TUBING W/ 60 BBLS BREAK DOWN 

STAGE 2 PERFS @ 5240'  14.2 BBLS PER MIN. PUMPED 7800 

GALS OF 15% HCL ACID. STARTED COMMUNICATING UP CSG. 

@ 3500 PSI . OPENED CSG AND FLUSHED TBG.

11:00 16:51 5.85 PRDHEQ 39 P LEFT PLUG IN WELL.RELEASED PKR TOOH W/ 291-JTS 3 1/2 

P-110, X-OVER, LD 34-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, 5" PKR 

(ELEMENTS WERE GONE) 4' TBG SUB AND RETRIEVING HEAD. 

RIH W/ 7" PKR, X-OVER AND 230-JTS 3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG EOT 

@ 7273' SECURED WELL SDFN.

11/7/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 INSTUB 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TBG AND 

PUMPING ACID.

 7:30 10:00 2.50 STG03 39 P TIH W /84-JTS 3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG. WELL STARTED 

DISPLACING OIL STOPPED AND CIRCULATE WELL W/ 90 BBLS.

10:00 13:00 3.00 STG03 35 P RU PUMP TRUCKS. PUMPED STAGE 2 AND 3 PUMPED 23730 

GALS 15% HCL ACID W/ 360 BIO-BALLS. AVG RATE 15.1, MAX 

RATE 17.2, AVG PRESS 6850, MAX PRESS 7160. ISIP 3667, 5 

MIN 3599 PSI, 10 MIN 3576, 15 MIN 3541 PSI, SHUT WELL IN RD 

ACIDIZERS.

13:00 13:30 0.50 STG03 19 P RU FLOW BACK LINE OPENED WELL ON 16/64 CHOKE. 3300 

PSI.

13:30  6:00 16.50 STG03 19 P 100 PSI 16/ 64 CHOKE. 0 OIL 0 GAS, 439 BBLS WATER.

11/8/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON LAYING DOWN 

TBG.FILLED OUT JSA

 7:30  9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 19 P WELL WAS FLOWING 100 PSI ON 16/64 CHOKE. OPENED WELL 

ON FULL 2" VALVE, FLOWED 50 BBLS OIL IN 2 HRS.

 9:30 12:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 06 P RELEASED PKR @ 9904' CICRULATE WELL CONVENTIONAL W/ 

366 BBLS 2% KCL.

 2December 09, 2011 at 12:42 pm OpenWells  Dec. 09, 2011

Sundry Number: 21138 API Well Number: 43013311360000

WESTERN

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETIN ON WIRELINE SAFETY

FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH Wl98-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER, 33-JTS 2 3/8

N-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER, 5 "SCRAPER & 4 1/8" BIT.
9:00 11:00 2.00 CHLOG 22 P RU WIRELINE RIH W/ GRICCL LOGGED FROM 10700' TO9850'.
11:00 12:30 1.50 WHDTRE 09 P CHANGED OUT CSG VALVES ON B SECTIONOF WELLHEAD.
12:30 17:30 5.00 STGO1 21 P RIH PERFORATED FROM 10625 TO 9922' 387 HOLES USING 3

1/8 120 DEGREE PHASING 22.7 GM SHOTS, 6 RUNS WHILE
PUM[PING 352 BBLS DOWN CSG LAST RU FLUID LEVEL @
7545'. PERFS PICKED FROM DUAL INDUCTION FOCUSED LOG
DATED 2/27/1986. CORRELATED TO PIONEER CCL/ GR LOG
DATED 11-3-2011. SECURED WELL SDFN.

11/5/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON PICKING UP TUBING
AND OVER HEAD HAZARDS.

7:30 16:30 9.00 WBP 24 P TALLIED AND PU 5" PLUG, RH, 4'2 7/8 N-80 TBG SUB, 5" PKR,
34-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER, 321-JTS 31/2 P-110 EUE
TBG. SET PLUG 14' OUT ON JT # 321 @ 11200'. TOOH W/
22-JTS 3 1/2 SET PKR @ 10637'

16:30 20:30 4.00 STGO1 35 P RU PUMP TRUCKS. PUMPED STAGE 1 PUMMPED 7500 GALS
15% HCL ACID W/ 192 BIO-BALLS THAN PUMPED 8000GALS 15
% HCL ACID. AVG RATE 13.8, MAX RATE 15.9, AVG PRESS
6499, MAX PRESS 6946. ISIP 2362, 5 MIN 1507 PSI, 10 MIN 1032,
15 MIN 671 PSI, 30 MIN 200.45 MIN O PSI RELEASED PKR
SECURED WELL SDFN.

11/6/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 STGO2 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TBG W/
PKR AND PLUG FILLED OUT JSA

7:30 9:00 1.50 STGO2 39 P TlH W/ 3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG. ENGAGED PLUG 11200'
RELEASED PLUG. SET PLUG @10630'15' OUT ON JT # 303. SET
PKR @ 10248' 8' OUT JT # 291.

9:00 11:00 2.00 STGO2 35 P RU ACIDIZERS. FILLED TUBING Wl60 BBLS BREAK DOWN
STAGE 2 PERFS @ 5240' 14.2 BBLS PER MIN. PUMPED 7800
GALS OF 15% HCL ACID. STARTED COMMUNICATING UP CSG.

@ 3500 PSI . OPENED CSG AND FLUSHED TBG.
11:00 16:51 5.85 PRDHEQ 39 P LEFT PLUG IN WELL.RELEASED PKR TOOH Wl291-JTS 31/2

P-110, X-OVER, LD 34-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, 5" PKR
(ELEMENTS WERE GONE) 4' TBG SUB AND RETRIEVING HEAD.
RIH W/ 7" PKR, X-OVER AND 230-JTS 3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG EOT

@ 7273' SECURED WELL SDFN.
11/7/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 INSTUB 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TBG AND

PUMPING ACID.
7:30 10:00 2.50 STGO3 39 P TlH Wl84-JTS 31/2 P-110 EUE TBG. WELL STARTED

DISPLACING OIL STOPPED AND CIRCULATE WELL Wl90 BBLS.
10:00 13:00 3.00 STGO3 35 P RU PUMP TRUCKS. PUMPED STAGE 2 AND 3 PUMPED 23730

GALS 15% HCL ACID W/ 360 BIO-BALLS. AVG RATE 15.1, MAX
RATE 17.2, AVG PRESS 6850, MAX PRESS 7160. ISIP 3667, 5
MIN 3599 PSI, 10 MIN 3576, 15 MIN 3541 PSI, SHUT WELL IN RD
ACIDIZERS.

13:00 13:30 0.50 STGO3 19 P RU FLOW BACK LINE OPENED WELL ON 16/64 CHOKE. 3300
PSI.

13:30 6:00 16.50 STGO3 19 P 100 PSI 16/ 64 CHOKE. O OIL 0 GAS, 439 BBLS WATER.

11/8/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON LAYING DOWN
TBG.FILLED OUT JSA

7:30 9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 19 P WELL WAS FLOWING 100 PSI ON 16/64 CHOKE. OPENED WELL
ON FULL 2" VALVE, FLOWED 50 BBLS OIL IN 2 HRS.

9:30 12:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 06 P RELEASED PKR @ 9904' CICRULATE WELL CONVENTIONAL W/
366 BBLS 2% KCL.

December 09, 2011 at 12:42 pm 2



WESTERN

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

12:30 17:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P LD 177-JTS 3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG. EOT 4002'. SECURED WELL 

SDFN

11/9/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON LAYING DOWN 

TUBING AND CAT WALK. FILLED OUT JSA.

 7:30  9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 06 P TBG FROZE. 200 CSIP OPENED CSG FLOWED 40 BBLS WATER 

AND OIL.THAWED OUT TBG. EOT @ 4002' CIRCULATE WELL W/ 

240 BBLS 2 % KCL.

 9:00 11:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P LD 137-JTS 3 1/2 N-80 EUE, X-OVER AND 7" PKR.

11:30 12:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P CHANGE OVER TO RUN 2 7/8 TBG

12:30 17:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TIH W/ RET HEAD, 22-JTS 2 3/8,X-OVER AND 294-JTS 2 7/8 

N-80 EUE TBG EOT @ 10168 SECURED WELL SDFN.

11/10/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON RUNNING PUMP 

LINES AND TRIPPING TUBING. FILLED OUT JSA.

 7:30  8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P 200 TSIP 200 CSIP BLED DOWN WELL PUMPED 30 BBLS DOWN 

TBG.

 8:30 10:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ 15-JTS 2 7/8 N-80EUE TBG. REVERSE CICRULATE W/ 90 

BBLS LATCHED ON TO RBP. RELEASED RBP.

10:00 14:30 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 304-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUETBG, X-OVER 22-JTS 2 3/8 

N-80 EUE TBG, RH AND 5" RBP.

14:30 17:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ SOLID PLUG, 2-JTS 2 3/8 N-80 EUE TBG, 4' 2 3/8 PERF 

J-55 SUB,PSN, 4-JTS 2 3/8 N-80 EUE TBG, 5" TAC, 8-JTS 2 3/8 

N-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER AND 280-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. EOT 

@ 8575' SECURED WELL SDFN.

11/11/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON ND BOPS. FILLED 

OUT JSA

 7:30  8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 19 P 270 TSIP, 380 CSIP. BLED DOWN WELL.

 8:30  9:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ 62-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EIUE TBG.SET 5"TAC @10373' SN 

10504'.

 9:30 11:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 16 P RD RIG FLOOR ND BOPS NU WELLHEAD.

11:00 12:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P FLUSHED TBG W/ 60 BBLS.

12:00 16:30 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ 2" X 1 1/2" X 36' PUMP, 10-1 1/2" WEIGHT BARS, 

186-3/4", 116-7/8" 103-1".SPACED OUT RODS W/ 1-8',1-2'X1" 

SUBS.

16:30 17:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P FILLED WELL W/ 35 BBLS PRESSURE AND STROKE TEST @ 

1000 PSI HELD.

17:00 18:30 1.50 RDMO 02 P RD RIG SLIDE ROTAFLEX. PUT ON PRODUCTION.

 3December 09, 2011 at 12:42 pm OpenWells  Dec. 09, 2011

Sundry Number: 21138 API Well Number: 43013311360000

WESTERN

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
12:30 17:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P LD 177-JTS 31/2 P-110 EUE TBG. EOT 4002'. SECURED WELL

SDFN
11/9/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON LAYING DOWN

TUBING AND CAT WALK. FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 06 P TBG FROZE. 200 CSIP OPENED CSG FLOWED 40 BBLS WATER

AND OIL.THAWED OUT TBG. EOT @4002' CIRCULATE WELL W/
240 BBLS 2 % KCL.

9:00 11:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P LD 137-JTS 31/2 N-80 EUE, X-OVER AND 7" PKR.
11:30 12:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P CHANGE OVER TO RUN 2 7/8 TBG
12:30 17:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TlH W/ RET HEAD, 22-JTS 2 3/8,X-OVER AND 294-JTS 2 7/8

N-80 EUE TBG EOT @ 10168 SECURED WELL SDFN.
11/10/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON RUNNING PUMP

LINES AND TRIPPING TUBING. FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P 200 TSIP 200 CSIP BLED DOWN WELL PUMPED 30 BBLS DOWN

TBG.
8:30 10:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH Wl15-JTS2 7/8 N-80EUE TBG. REVERSE CICRULATE Wl90

BBLS LATCHED ON TO RBP. RELEASED RBP.
10:00 14:30 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 304-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUETBG, X-OVER 22-JTS 2 3/8

N-80 EUE TBG, RH AND 5" RBP.
14:30 17:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ SOLID PLUG, 2-JTS 2 3/8 N-80 EUE TBG, 4'2 3/8 PERF

J-55 SUB,PSN, 4-JTS 2 3/8 N-80 EUE TBG, 5" TAC, 8-JTS 2 3/8
N-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER AND 280-JTS2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. EOT

@8575' SECURED WELL SDFN.
11/11/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON ND BOPS. FILLED

OUT JSA
7:30 8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 19 P 270 TSIP, 380 CSIP. BLED DOWN WELL.
8:30 9:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ 62-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 ElUE TBG.SET 5"TAC @10373'SN

10504'.
9:30 11:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 16 P RD RIG FLOOR ND BOPS NU WELLHEAD.
11:00 12:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P FLUSHED TBG Wl60 BBLS.
12:00 16:30 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH Wl2"X 1 1/2" X 36' PUMP, 10-1 1/2" WEIGHT BARS,

186-3/4", 116-7/8" 103-1".SPACED OUT RODS W/ 1-8',1-2'X1"

SUBS.
16:30 17:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P FILLED WELL W/ 35 BBLS PRESSURE AND STROKE TEST @

1000 PSI HELD.
17:00 18:30 1.50 RDMO 02 P RD RIG SLIDE ROTAFLEX. PUT ON PRODUCTION.

December 09, 2011 at 12:42 pm 3



Don Staley - Re: El Paso Well Name Corrections (Remove 'R' from name) 

  
Dustin, 
  
I can't find any explanation for why the 'R' was added, but it first appeared on the February 2002 Production 
Book.  That means the well name change took place somewhere between June 6, 2002 (when the January 2002 
book was run) and July 2, 2002 (when the February 2002 book was run).  There was nothing in the database 
comments or the well file showing that the operator requested a name change.  I removed the 'R' from the well 
name in the database and will include a copy of this message in the well file for documentation. 
  
The same story applies to all of these El Paso wells and all have been corrected: 
  
Murdock 2-34B5 R    (4301331132) 
Murdock 2-26B5 R    (4301331124) 
Robb 2-29B5 R         (4301331130) 
Ute 2-33Z2 R           (4301331111) 
Jenkins 2-12B3 R      (4301331121) 
Lake Fork 2-13B4 R   (4301331134) 
Hanson 2-9B3 R        (4301331136) 
Ute 2-31A2 R            (4301331139) 
Lindsay 2-33A4 R      (4301331141) 
  
Don 
 
>>> Dustin Doucet 12/28/2011 5:10 PM >>> 
Don, 
  
El Paso called wondering where the "R" came from on the well name for the Murdock 2-34B5 well (in database 
as Murdock 2-34B5 R).  No notes as to a name change all documents prior to the recent electronic submittals 
did not have R, the two electronic docs have the R indicating the DB had been changed prior to that date.  
Unless we are missing pages that would have been 2001 at the latest.  Probably somebody accidently hit a 
button to add it when they were adding something to the record for this well.  Hopefully not a more serious 
issue.  At any rate,  El Paso doesn't want the R on there, wondered why it was done.  I told them we would take 
it off and didn't know how it came to be.  Can you take care of this?  Thanks. 
  
Dustin 

From:    Don Staley
To:    Dustin Doucet
Date:    01/04/2012 9:15 AM
Subject:   Re: El Paso Well Name Corrections (Remove 'R' from name)

Page 1 of 1
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Don Staley - Re: El Paso Well Name Corrections (Remove 'R' from name)

From: Don Staley
To: Dustin Doucet
Date: 01/04/2012 9:15 AM
Subject: Re: El Paso Well Name Corrections (Remove 'R' from name)

Dustin,

I can't find any explanation for why the 'R' was added, but it first appeared on the February 2002 Production
Book. That means the well name change took place somewhere between June 6, 2002 (when the January 2002
book was run) and July 2, 2002 (when the February 2002 book was run). There was nothing in the database
comments or the well file showing that the operator requested a name change. I removed the 'R' from the well
name in the database and will include a copy of this message in the well file for documentation.

The same story applies to all of these El Paso wells and all have been corrected:

Murdock 2-34B5 R (4301331132)
Murdock 2-26B5 R (4301331124)
Robb 2-29B5 R (4301331130)
Ute 2-33Z2 R (4301331111)
Jenkins 2-12B3 R (4301331121)
Lake Fork 2-13B4 R (4301331134)
Hanson 2-9B3 R (4301331136)
Ute 2-31A2 R (4301331139)
Lindsay 2-33A4 R (4301331141)

Don

>>> Dustin Doucet 12/28/2011 5:10 PM >>>

Don,

El Paso called wondering where the "R" came from on the well name for the Murdock 2-34B5 well (in database
as Murdock 2-34B5 R). No notes as to a name change all documents prior to the recent electronic submittals
did not have R, the two electronic docs have the R indicating the DB had been changed prior to that date.
Unless we are missing pages that would have been 2001 at the latest. Probably somebody accidently hit a
button to add it when they were adding something to the record for this well. Hopefully not a more serious
issue. At any rate, El Paso doesn't want the R on there, wondered why it was done. I toldthem we would take
it off and didn't know how it came to be. Can you take care of this? Thanks.

Dustin

file://C:\Documents and Settings\dstaley\Local Settings\Temp\XPgrpwise\4F04189ANRDO...



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 HANSON 2-9B3 R 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43013311360000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1531 FSL 1461 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 09 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

11/10/2011

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Please see attached Operations Summary for details.  

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038

TITLE
 Principle Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 12/9/2011

12/12/2011

Dec. 09, 2011

Sundry Number: 21138 API Well Number: 43013311360000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well HANSON 2-9B3 R

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP 43013311360000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 E×t ALTAMONT

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1531 FSL 1461 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 09 Township: 02.05 Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

11/10/2011 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR RErt
D e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached Operations Summary for details.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Principle Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



WESTERN

1       General

1.1       Customer Information

WESTERNCompany

Representative

Address

1.2       Well Information

HANSON 2-9B3RWell

HANSON 2-9B3RSiteALTAMONT FIELDProject

Event RECOMPLETE LANDPEAK/700 *Rig Name/No.

Start Date 10/31/2011 End Date

12/18/1985Spud Date UWI 009-002-S 003-W 30

Active Datum Kelly Bushing @5,950.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)

Afe 

No./Description

155728/44010 / HANSON 2-9 B3-R

2       Summary

2.1       Operation Summary

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

11/1/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 MIRU 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TOOH W/ RODS 

FILLED OUT JSA.

 7:30 10:00 2.50 MIRU 01 P SLID ROTA-FLEX, MIRU RIG WHILE PUMPING 60 BBLS DOWN 

CSG.

10:00 11:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P UNSEAT PUMP FLUSH TBG W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL.

11:00 14:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 118-1", 117-7/8 (LD 5-7/8 ROD WEAR) 140-3/4,24-1" 

AND 2 1/2" X 1 1/2" X 36' PUMP

14:00 16:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 16 P ND WELLHEAD NU BOPS.RELEASED TAC.

16:30 18:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 102 JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. EOT @ 6988'.SECURED 

WELL SDFN.

11/2/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P  CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY ON TRIPPING TUBGING AND 

TUBING TONGS FILLED OUT JSA.

 7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P CONTINUED TOOH W/ 205 JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUETBG, 7" TAC, 

6-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUETBG, SN, 6' TBG SUB, 4 1/2 PBGA, 1-JT 2 

7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, SOLID PLUG AND 5 3/4" NO-GO.

10:30 15:30 5.00 WBP 39 TALLIED AND RIH W/ 6 1/8" BIT,SCRAPER, X-OVER AND 318 

JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. TAGGED LINER @ 12210' 8' IN ON JT # 

318.

15:30 18:00 2.50 WBP 39 TOOH W/ 120- JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. EOT @6332' SECURED 

WELL SDFN

11/3/2011  6:30  7:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL, HELD SAFETY MTNG (TRIPPING TUBING). 

WRITE & REVIEW JSA'S.

 7:00  9:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 198 JNTS 2 7/8" EUE TBNG. L/D X-O SUB. 7" 

SCRAPPER. 6 1/8" RB. CHANGE OVER TO 2 3/8" TBNG 

EQUIPMENT.

 9:30 14:30 5.00 PRDHEQ 39 P P/U 4 1/8" RB. 5" SCRAPPER. X-O SUB. RIH P/U 33 JNTS 2 3/8" 

N-80 EUE TBNG. X-O 2 3/8" EUE X 2 7/8" EUE. 5 3/4" NO-GO. RIH 

OUT OF DERRICK W/ 318 JNTS 2 7/8" N-80 EUE TBNG TO 

11,292'. SPOT IN PIPE RACKS. UNLOAD 331 JNTS 3 1/2" TBNG.

14:30 15:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P R/U HOT OILER. FLUSH TBNG W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL WTR. @220 

DEG.

15:30 18:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 220 JNTS 2 7/8" N-80 EUE TBNG. EOT @4,296'. 

SECURE WELL S.D.F.N.

11/4/2011

 1December 09, 2011 at 12:42 pm OpenWells  Dec. 09, 2011

Sundry Number: 21138 API Well Number: 43013311360000

WESTERN

1 General

1.1 Customer Information

Companv WESTERN

Representative
Address

1.2 Well Information

Well HANSON 2-9B3R

Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site HANSON 2-9B3R

Rig Name/No. PEAK/700 * Event RECOMPLETE LAND

Start Date 10/31/2011 End Date
Spud Date 12/18/1985 UWI 009-002-5 OO3-W30

Active Datum Kelly Bushing @5,950.Oft (above Mean Sea Level)

Afe 155728/44010 / HANSON 2-9 B3-R

No.lDescription

2 Summary

2.1 Operation Summary

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
11/1/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 MIRU 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TOOH W/ RODS

FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 10:00 2.50 MIRU 01 P SLID ROTA-FLEX, MIRU RIG WHILE PUMPING 60 BBLS DOWN

CSG.
10:00 11:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P UNSEAT PUMP FLUSH TBG Wl60 BBLS 2% KCL.
11:00 14:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/118-1", 117-7/8 (LD 5-7/8 ROD WEAR) 140-3/4,24-1"

AND 2 1/2" X 1 1/2" X 36' PUMP
14:00 16:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 16 P ND WELLHEAD NU BOPS.RELEASED TAC.
16:30 18:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH Wl102 JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. EOT @6988'.SECURED

WELL SDFN.
11/2/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY ON TRIPPING TUBGING AND

TUBING TONGS FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P CONTINUED TOOH Wl205 JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUETBG, 7" TAC,

6-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUETBG, SN, 6' TBG SUB, 4 1/2 PBGA, 1-JT 2
7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, SOLID PLUG AND 5 3/4" NO-GO.

10:30 15:30 5.00 WBP 39 TALLIED AND RIH W/ 6 1/8" BIT,SCRAPER, X-OVER AND 318
JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. TAGGED LINER @ 12210' 8' IN ON JT #
318.

15:30 18:00 2.50 WBP 39 TOOH W/ 120- JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. EOT @6332'SECURED
WELL SDFN

11/3/2011 6:30 7:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL, HELD SAFETY MTNG (TRIPPING TUBING).
WRITE & REVIEW JSA'S.

7:00 9:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH Wl198 JNTS 2 7/8" EUE TBNG. L/D X-O SUB. 7"
SCRAPPER. 6 1/8" RB. CHANGE OVER TO 2 3/8" TBNG
EQUIPMENT.

9:30 14:30 5.00 PRDHEQ 39 P P/U 4 1/8" RB. 5" SCRAPPER. X-O SUB. RIH P/U 33 JNTS 2 3/8"
N-80 EUE TBNG.X-O 2 3/8" EUE X 2 7/8" EUE. 5 3/4" NO-GO. RIH
OUT OF DERRICK W/ 318 JNTS 2 7/8" N-80 EUE TBNG TO
11,292'. SPOT IN PIPE RACKS. UNLOAD 331 JNTS 3 1/2" TBNG.

14:30 15:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P R/U HOT OILER. FLUSH TBNG Wl60 BBLS 2% KCL WTR. @220
DEG.

15:30 18:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH Wl220 JNTS 2 7/8" N-80 EUE TBNG. EOT @4,296'.
SECURE WELL S.D.F.N.

11/4/2011

December 09, 2011 at 12:42 pm 1



WESTERN

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

 6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETIN ON WIRELINE SAFETY 

FILLED OUT JSA.

 7:30  9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 98-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER, 33-JTS 2 3/8 

N-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER, 5 " SCRAPER & 4 1/8" BIT.

 9:00 11:00 2.00 CHLOG 22 P RU WIRELINE RIH W/ GR/CCL LOGGED FROM 10700' TO 9850'.

11:00 12:30 1.50 WHDTRE 09 P CHANGED OUT CSG VALVES ON B SECTIONOF WELLHEAD.

12:30 17:30 5.00 STG01 21 P RIH PERFORATED FROM 10625 TO 9922' 387 HOLES USING 3 

1/8 120 DEGREE PHASING 22.7 GM SHOTS, 6 RUNS WHILE 

PUM[PING 352 BBLS DOWN CSG LAST RU FLUID LEVEL @ 

7545'. PERFS PICKED FROM DUAL INDUCTION FOCUSED LOG 

DATED 2/27/1986. CORRELATED TO PIONEER CCL/ GR LOG 

DATED 11-3-2011. SECURED WELL SDFN.

11/5/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON PICKING UP TUBING 

AND OVER HEAD HAZARDS.

 7:30 16:30 9.00 WBP 24 P TALLIED AND PU 5" PLUG, RH, 4' 2 7/8 N-80 TBG SUB, 5" PKR, 

34-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER, 321-JTS 3 1/2 P-110 EUE 

TBG. SET PLUG 14' OUT ON JT # 321 @ 11200'. TOOH W/ 

22-JTS 3 1/2 SET PKR @ 10637'

16:30 20:30 4.00 STG01 35 P RU PUMP TRUCKS. PUMPED STAGE 1 PUMMPED 7500 GALS 

15% HCL ACID W/ 192 BIO-BALLS THAN PUMPED 8000GALS 15 

% HCL ACID. AVG RATE 13.8, MAX RATE 15.9, AVG PRESS 

6499, MAX PRESS 6946. ISIP 2362, 5 MIN 1507 PSI, 10 MIN 1032, 

15 MIN 671 PSI, 30 MIN 200.45 MIN 0 PSI RELEASED PKR 

SECURED WELL SDFN.

11/6/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 STG02 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TBG W/ 

PKR AND PLUG FILLED OUT JSA

 7:30  9:00 1.50 STG02 39 P TIH W/  3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG. ENGAGED PLUG 11200' 

RELEASED PLUG. SET PLUG @10630' 15' OUT ON JT # 303. SET 

PKR @ 10248' 8' OUT JT # 291.

 9:00 11:00 2.00 STG02 35 P RU ACIDIZERS. FILLED TUBING W/ 60 BBLS BREAK DOWN 

STAGE 2 PERFS @ 5240'  14.2 BBLS PER MIN. PUMPED 7800 

GALS OF 15% HCL ACID. STARTED COMMUNICATING UP CSG. 

@ 3500 PSI . OPENED CSG AND FLUSHED TBG.

11:00 16:51 5.85 PRDHEQ 39 P LEFT PLUG IN WELL.RELEASED PKR TOOH W/ 291-JTS 3 1/2 

P-110, X-OVER, LD 34-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, 5" PKR 

(ELEMENTS WERE GONE) 4' TBG SUB AND RETRIEVING HEAD. 

RIH W/ 7" PKR, X-OVER AND 230-JTS 3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG EOT 

@ 7273' SECURED WELL SDFN.

11/7/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 INSTUB 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TBG AND 

PUMPING ACID.

 7:30 10:00 2.50 STG03 39 P TIH W /84-JTS 3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG. WELL STARTED 

DISPLACING OIL STOPPED AND CIRCULATE WELL W/ 90 BBLS.

10:00 13:00 3.00 STG03 35 P RU PUMP TRUCKS. PUMPED STAGE 2 AND 3 PUMPED 23730 

GALS 15% HCL ACID W/ 360 BIO-BALLS. AVG RATE 15.1, MAX 

RATE 17.2, AVG PRESS 6850, MAX PRESS 7160. ISIP 3667, 5 

MIN 3599 PSI, 10 MIN 3576, 15 MIN 3541 PSI, SHUT WELL IN RD 

ACIDIZERS.

13:00 13:30 0.50 STG03 19 P RU FLOW BACK LINE OPENED WELL ON 16/64 CHOKE. 3300 

PSI.

13:30  6:00 16.50 STG03 19 P 100 PSI 16/ 64 CHOKE. 0 OIL 0 GAS, 439 BBLS WATER.

11/8/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON LAYING DOWN 

TBG.FILLED OUT JSA

 7:30  9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 19 P WELL WAS FLOWING 100 PSI ON 16/64 CHOKE. OPENED WELL 

ON FULL 2" VALVE, FLOWED 50 BBLS OIL IN 2 HRS.

 9:30 12:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 06 P RELEASED PKR @ 9904' CICRULATE WELL CONVENTIONAL W/ 

366 BBLS 2% KCL.

 2December 09, 2011 at 12:42 pm OpenWells  Dec. 09, 2011

Sundry Number: 21138 API Well Number: 43013311360000

WESTERN

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETIN ON WIRELINE SAFETY

FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH Wl98-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER, 33-JTS 2 3/8

N-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER, 5 "SCRAPER & 4 1/8" BIT.
9:00 11:00 2.00 CHLOG 22 P RU WIRELINE RIH W/ GRICCL LOGGED FROM 10700' TO9850'.
11:00 12:30 1.50 WHDTRE 09 P CHANGED OUT CSG VALVES ON B SECTIONOF WELLHEAD.
12:30 17:30 5.00 STGO1 21 P RIH PERFORATED FROM 10625 TO 9922' 387 HOLES USING 3

1/8 120 DEGREE PHASING 22.7 GM SHOTS, 6 RUNS WHILE
PUM[PING 352 BBLS DOWN CSG LAST RU FLUID LEVEL @
7545'. PERFS PICKED FROM DUAL INDUCTION FOCUSED LOG
DATED 2/27/1986. CORRELATED TO PIONEER CCL/ GR LOG
DATED 11-3-2011. SECURED WELL SDFN.

11/5/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON PICKING UP TUBING
AND OVER HEAD HAZARDS.

7:30 16:30 9.00 WBP 24 P TALLIED AND PU 5" PLUG, RH, 4'2 7/8 N-80 TBG SUB, 5" PKR,
34-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER, 321-JTS 31/2 P-110 EUE
TBG. SET PLUG 14' OUT ON JT # 321 @ 11200'. TOOH W/
22-JTS 3 1/2 SET PKR @ 10637'

16:30 20:30 4.00 STGO1 35 P RU PUMP TRUCKS. PUMPED STAGE 1 PUMMPED 7500 GALS
15% HCL ACID W/ 192 BIO-BALLS THAN PUMPED 8000GALS 15
% HCL ACID. AVG RATE 13.8, MAX RATE 15.9, AVG PRESS
6499, MAX PRESS 6946. ISIP 2362, 5 MIN 1507 PSI, 10 MIN 1032,
15 MIN 671 PSI, 30 MIN 200.45 MIN O PSI RELEASED PKR
SECURED WELL SDFN.

11/6/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 STGO2 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TBG W/
PKR AND PLUG FILLED OUT JSA

7:30 9:00 1.50 STGO2 39 P TlH W/ 3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG. ENGAGED PLUG 11200'
RELEASED PLUG. SET PLUG @10630'15' OUT ON JT # 303. SET
PKR @ 10248' 8' OUT JT # 291.

9:00 11:00 2.00 STGO2 35 P RU ACIDIZERS. FILLED TUBING Wl60 BBLS BREAK DOWN
STAGE 2 PERFS @ 5240' 14.2 BBLS PER MIN. PUMPED 7800
GALS OF 15% HCL ACID. STARTED COMMUNICATING UP CSG.

@ 3500 PSI . OPENED CSG AND FLUSHED TBG.
11:00 16:51 5.85 PRDHEQ 39 P LEFT PLUG IN WELL.RELEASED PKR TOOH Wl291-JTS 31/2

P-110, X-OVER, LD 34-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, 5" PKR
(ELEMENTS WERE GONE) 4' TBG SUB AND RETRIEVING HEAD.
RIH W/ 7" PKR, X-OVER AND 230-JTS 3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG EOT

@ 7273' SECURED WELL SDFN.
11/7/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 INSTUB 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TBG AND

PUMPING ACID.
7:30 10:00 2.50 STGO3 39 P TlH Wl84-JTS 31/2 P-110 EUE TBG. WELL STARTED

DISPLACING OIL STOPPED AND CIRCULATE WELL Wl90 BBLS.
10:00 13:00 3.00 STGO3 35 P RU PUMP TRUCKS. PUMPED STAGE 2 AND 3 PUMPED 23730

GALS 15% HCL ACID W/ 360 BIO-BALLS. AVG RATE 15.1, MAX
RATE 17.2, AVG PRESS 6850, MAX PRESS 7160. ISIP 3667, 5
MIN 3599 PSI, 10 MIN 3576, 15 MIN 3541 PSI, SHUT WELL IN RD
ACIDIZERS.

13:00 13:30 0.50 STGO3 19 P RU FLOW BACK LINE OPENED WELL ON 16/64 CHOKE. 3300
PSI.

13:30 6:00 16.50 STGO3 19 P 100 PSI 16/ 64 CHOKE. O OIL 0 GAS, 439 BBLS WATER.

11/8/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON LAYING DOWN
TBG.FILLED OUT JSA

7:30 9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 19 P WELL WAS FLOWING 100 PSI ON 16/64 CHOKE. OPENED WELL
ON FULL 2" VALVE, FLOWED 50 BBLS OIL IN 2 HRS.

9:30 12:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 06 P RELEASED PKR @ 9904' CICRULATE WELL CONVENTIONAL W/
366 BBLS 2% KCL.

December 09, 2011 at 12:42 pm 2



WESTERN

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

12:30 17:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P LD 177-JTS 3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG. EOT 4002'. SECURED WELL 

SDFN

11/9/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON LAYING DOWN 

TUBING AND CAT WALK. FILLED OUT JSA.

 7:30  9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 06 P TBG FROZE. 200 CSIP OPENED CSG FLOWED 40 BBLS WATER 

AND OIL.THAWED OUT TBG. EOT @ 4002' CIRCULATE WELL W/ 

240 BBLS 2 % KCL.

 9:00 11:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P LD 137-JTS 3 1/2 N-80 EUE, X-OVER AND 7" PKR.

11:30 12:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P CHANGE OVER TO RUN 2 7/8 TBG

12:30 17:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TIH W/ RET HEAD, 22-JTS 2 3/8,X-OVER AND 294-JTS 2 7/8 

N-80 EUE TBG EOT @ 10168 SECURED WELL SDFN.

11/10/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON RUNNING PUMP 

LINES AND TRIPPING TUBING. FILLED OUT JSA.

 7:30  8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P 200 TSIP 200 CSIP BLED DOWN WELL PUMPED 30 BBLS DOWN 

TBG.

 8:30 10:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ 15-JTS 2 7/8 N-80EUE TBG. REVERSE CICRULATE W/ 90 

BBLS LATCHED ON TO RBP. RELEASED RBP.

10:00 14:30 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 304-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUETBG, X-OVER 22-JTS 2 3/8 

N-80 EUE TBG, RH AND 5" RBP.

14:30 17:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ SOLID PLUG, 2-JTS 2 3/8 N-80 EUE TBG, 4' 2 3/8 PERF 

J-55 SUB,PSN, 4-JTS 2 3/8 N-80 EUE TBG, 5" TAC, 8-JTS 2 3/8 

N-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER AND 280-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. EOT 

@ 8575' SECURED WELL SDFN.

11/11/2011  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON ND BOPS. FILLED 

OUT JSA

 7:30  8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 19 P 270 TSIP, 380 CSIP. BLED DOWN WELL.

 8:30  9:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ 62-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EIUE TBG.SET 5"TAC @10373' SN 

10504'.

 9:30 11:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 16 P RD RIG FLOOR ND BOPS NU WELLHEAD.

11:00 12:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P FLUSHED TBG W/ 60 BBLS.

12:00 16:30 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ 2" X 1 1/2" X 36' PUMP, 10-1 1/2" WEIGHT BARS, 

186-3/4", 116-7/8" 103-1".SPACED OUT RODS W/ 1-8',1-2'X1" 

SUBS.

16:30 17:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P FILLED WELL W/ 35 BBLS PRESSURE AND STROKE TEST @ 

1000 PSI HELD.

17:00 18:30 1.50 RDMO 02 P RD RIG SLIDE ROTAFLEX. PUT ON PRODUCTION.

 3December 09, 2011 at 12:42 pm OpenWells  Dec. 09, 2011

Sundry Number: 21138 API Well Number: 43013311360000

WESTERN

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
12:30 17:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P LD 177-JTS 31/2 P-110 EUE TBG. EOT 4002'. SECURED WELL

SDFN
11/9/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON LAYING DOWN

TUBING AND CAT WALK. FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 06 P TBG FROZE. 200 CSIP OPENED CSG FLOWED 40 BBLS WATER

AND OIL.THAWED OUT TBG. EOT @4002' CIRCULATE WELL W/
240 BBLS 2 % KCL.

9:00 11:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P LD 137-JTS 31/2 N-80 EUE, X-OVER AND 7" PKR.
11:30 12:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P CHANGE OVER TO RUN 2 7/8 TBG
12:30 17:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TlH W/ RET HEAD, 22-JTS 2 3/8,X-OVER AND 294-JTS 2 7/8

N-80 EUE TBG EOT @ 10168 SECURED WELL SDFN.
11/10/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON RUNNING PUMP

LINES AND TRIPPING TUBING. FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P 200 TSIP 200 CSIP BLED DOWN WELL PUMPED 30 BBLS DOWN

TBG.
8:30 10:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH Wl15-JTS2 7/8 N-80EUE TBG. REVERSE CICRULATE Wl90

BBLS LATCHED ON TO RBP. RELEASED RBP.
10:00 14:30 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 304-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUETBG, X-OVER 22-JTS 2 3/8

N-80 EUE TBG, RH AND 5" RBP.
14:30 17:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ SOLID PLUG, 2-JTS 2 3/8 N-80 EUE TBG, 4'2 3/8 PERF

J-55 SUB,PSN, 4-JTS 2 3/8 N-80 EUE TBG, 5" TAC, 8-JTS 2 3/8
N-80 EUE TBG, X-OVER AND 280-JTS2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. EOT

@8575' SECURED WELL SDFN.
11/11/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON ND BOPS. FILLED

OUT JSA
7:30 8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 19 P 270 TSIP, 380 CSIP. BLED DOWN WELL.
8:30 9:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ 62-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 ElUE TBG.SET 5"TAC @10373'SN

10504'.
9:30 11:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 16 P RD RIG FLOOR ND BOPS NU WELLHEAD.
11:00 12:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P FLUSHED TBG Wl60 BBLS.
12:00 16:30 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH Wl2"X 1 1/2" X 36' PUMP, 10-1 1/2" WEIGHT BARS,

186-3/4", 116-7/8" 103-1".SPACED OUT RODS W/ 1-8',1-2'X1"

SUBS.
16:30 17:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P FILLED WELL W/ 35 BBLS PRESSURE AND STROKE TEST @

1000 PSI HELD.
17:00 18:30 1.50 RDMO 02 P RD RIG SLIDE ROTAFLEX. PUT ON PRODUCTION.
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2012

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N3065- El Paso E&P Company, L.P. N3850- EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX. 77002 Houston, TX. 77002

Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038 Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038

CA No. Unit: N/A

LL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/25/2012
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/25/2012
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/27/2012
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 2114377-0181
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Yes
Sb. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: N/A
Sc. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 6/25/2012
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM N/A BIA Not Received
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: N/A
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: Second Oper Chg
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/29/2012
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/29/2012
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/29/:2012
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: N/A
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JUO705
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 6/29/2012
COMMENTS:
Disposal and Injections wells willbe moved when UIC 5 is received.

El Paso.xis



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

Multiple Leases
6 IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do notuse thisform for proposals to drillnewwells,significantlydeepen existingwells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, orto
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER See Attached

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

El Paso E&P Company, L.P. Attn: Maria Gomez
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1001 Louisiana ciTY Houston STATE TX ZIP 77002 (713) 997-5038 See Attached
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See Attached COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

« CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACl( WATER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOr10inalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUC1NG FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Change of
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Name/Operator

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please be advised that El Paso E&P Company, L.P. (current Operator) has changed names to EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
(new Operator) effective June 1, 2012 and that EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is considered the new operator of the attached
well locations.

EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is responsible under the termsand conditionsof the lease(s) for the operations conducted
upon leased lands. Bond coverage is provided by the State of Utah Statewide Blanket Bond No. 400JUO705, Bureau of Land
Management Nationwide Bond No. 103601420, and Bureau of Indian Affairs Nationwide Bond No. 103601473.

Frank W. Fallerr Frank W. Falleri
Vice President Sr. Vice President
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.

NAME(PLEAS NT) Maria S. Gomez TITLE Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE

E

DATE 6/22/2012

(ThisspaceforStateuseonly) RECEIVED
D JUN2 5 2012

. . . _ gee instrucuans on Reverse sd•) Olv.0F OIL,GAS&MINING"°°bivision of Oil,Gasand Mining-
Earlenekussell, Engineering Techniclaa



El Paso E1 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E1 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

Well Well
Well Name Sec TWP RNG API Number Entity Lease Type Type Status Conf
DVVR3-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301350070 14204621118 OVV APD C
LAKEWOOD ESTATES 3-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301350127 1420H621328 OW APD C
YOUNG3-15A3 15 010S 030W 4301350122 FEE OW APD C
WHITING4-1A2 01 010S 020W 4301350424 Fee OW APD C
ELFUMSO4-34A4 34 010S 040VV 4301350720 Fee OVV APD C
YOUNG 2-281 02 020S 010W 4304751180 FEE OW APD C
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-1084 10 020S 040W 4301350712 18221 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-2684 26 020S 040W 4301350714 18432 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-24B4 24 020S 040W 4301350717 18315 Fee OW DRL C
Cook4-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301351162 18449 Fee OVV DRL C
Peterson4-22C6 22 030S 060VV 4301351163 18518 Fee OVV DRL C
LakeForkRanch4-14B4 14 020S 040VV 4301351240 99999 Fee 04V DRL C
Ahelesco4-20C6 20 030S 060VV 4301351241 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Peck3-13BS 13 020S 050VV 4301351364 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Jensen2-9C4 09 030S 040VV 4301351375 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
El Paso 3-5C4 05 030S 040W 4301351376 18563 Fee OW DRL C
ULT6-31 31 030S 020E 4304740033 FEE O\¾ LA
OBERHANSLY 2-2A1 02 010S 010W 4304740164 FEE OW LA
DWR 3-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301351433 14-20-H62-4724 OW NEW C
LakeForkRanch5-23B4 23 0208 040VV 4301360739 Fee CNV NEVV
DuchesneLand4-10C5 10 030S 050VV 4301351262 Fee OVV NEVV C
Cabinland 4-9B3 09 020S 030W 4301351374 Fee OW NEW C
Layton 4-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301351389 Fee OW NEW C
Golinski4-24BS 24 020S 050VV 4301351404 Fee OiN NE\N C
AII>a1-21C4 21 030S 040VV 4301351460 Fee 04V NEVV C
Allison4-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301351466 Fee ONV NEVV C
Seeley 4-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301351486 Fee OW NEW C
Allen4-25B5 25 020S 050VV 4301351487 Fee OVV NEVV C
Hewett 2-6C4 06 030S 040W 4301351489 Fee OW NEW C
Young2-7C4 07 030S 040VV 4301351500 Fee OVV NEVV C
Brighton 3-31A1E 31 010S 010E 4304752471 Fee OW NEW C
Hamaker3-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304752491 Fee OVV NEVV C
Bolton3-29A1E 29 010S 010E 4304752871 Fee OVV NEVV C
HORROCKS5-20A1 20 010S 010W 4301334280 17378 FEE OW OPS C
DWR 3-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301334263 17440 14-20-462-1120 OW P
DWR 3-22C6 22 030S 060W 4301334106 17298 14-20-462-1131 OW P
DWR 3-28C6 28 030S 060W 4301334264 17360 14-20-462-1323 OW P
UTE 1-7A2 07 010S 020W 4301330025 5850 14-20-462-811 OW
UTE2-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301331033 10115 14-20-H62-1118 OiN P
WLRTRIBAL2-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301331035 10250 14-20-H62-1120 OW P
CEDAR RIM 10-A-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330615 6420 14-20-H62-1128 OW P
CEDAR RIM 12A B 030S 060W 4301331173 10672 14-20-H62-1323 OW P
UTE-FEE 2-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301331123 10365 14-20-H62-1328 OW P
TAYLOR3-34C6 34 030S 060VV 4301350200 17572 1420H621329 CNV P
BAKER UTE 2-34C6 34 030S 060W 4301332634 14590 14-20-H62-1329 OW P
UTE 3-35Z2 K 35 010N 020W 4301331133 10483 14-20-H62-1614 OW P
UTE 1-32Z2 32 010N 020W 4301330379 1915 14-20-H62-1702 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-33D 33 010N 020W 4301330334 1851 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTE 2-33Z2 33 010N 020W 4301331111 10451 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTETRIBAL2-34Z2 010N 020W 4301331167 10668 14-20-H62-1704 OW
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-13B4 13 020S 040W 4301334262 17439 14-20-H62-1743 OW P
Üii 1-28B4 28 020S 040VV 4301330242 1796 14-20-H62-1745 OVV P
UTE 1-34A4 34 010S 040W 4301330076 1585 14-20-H62-1774 OW P
UTE 1-36A4 36 010S 040VV 4301330069 1580 14-20-H62-1793 (MN P
UTE 1-1B4 01 020S 040W 4301330129 1700 14-20-H62-1798 OW P
UTE 1-31A2 31 010S 020VV 4301330401 1925 14-20-H62-1801 (MN P |



El Paso E2 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E2 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE1-25A3 25 010S 030VV4301330370 1920 'Wi-20-H62-1802 OVV P
UTE 2-25A3 25 010S 030W 4301331343 11361 14-20-H62-1802 OW P
UTE 1-26A3 26 OS 030W 4301330348 1890 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTE 2-26A3 26 010S 030W 4301331340 11349 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTETRIBAL4-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301350274 18009 1420H621804 OVV P C
UTE 2-35A3 35 010S 030W 4301331292 11222 14-20-H62-1804 ÖW P
UTE3-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301331365 11454 14-20-H62-1804 OIVV P
UTE 145B2 06 0208: 020VV4301330349 1895 14-20-H62-1807 O\N P
UTE 2-6B2 06 020S 020W 4301331140 11190 14-20-H62-1807 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-682 06 020S 020W 4301350273 18008 14-20-H62-1807 OW P C
POWELL 4-19A1 19 010S 010W 4301330071 8302 14-20-H62-1847 OW P
COLTHARP 1-27Z1 27 010N 010W 4301330151 4700 14-20-H62-1933 OW P
UTE 1-8A1E 08 010S 010E 4304730173 1846 14-20-H62-2147 OW P
UTETRIBE 1-31 31 010N 020VV 4301330278 4755 14-20-H62-2.421 OVV P
UTE 1-28B6X 28 020S 060W 4301330510 11165 14-20-H62-2492 OW P
RINKER 2-21B5 21 020S 050W 4301334166 17299 14-20-H62-2508 OW P
MURDOCK 2-34B5 34 020S 050W 4301331132 10456 14-20-H62-2511 OW P
LffE 1-3586 [35 0206; 060VV4301330507 2335 14-20-H62-2531 O\N P
UTE TRIBAL1-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304730829 860 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE 2-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304737831 16709 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE TRIBAL1-27A1E \27 010S 010E 4304730421 800 14-20-H62-2662 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-35A1E 35 010S 010E 4304730286 795 14-20-H62-2665 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-15A1E 15 010S 010E 4304730820 850 14-20-H62-2717 OW P
UTE TRIBAL P-3B1E 03 02 S 010E 4304730190 4536 14-20-H62-2873 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-22ATE 22 010S 010E 4304730429 810 14-20-H62-3103 OW P
BHUTE1-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301330419 10705 14-20-H62-3436 09/ P
BHUTE2-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301332790 15802 14-20-H62-3436 OV/ P
MCFARLANE 1-4D6 04 040S 060W 4301331074 10325 14-20-H62-3452 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-11D6 11 040S 060W 4301330482 6415 14-20-H62-3454 OW P
CARSON 2-36A1 36 010S 010W 4304731407 737 14-20-H62-3806 OW P
UTE 2-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301330775 9133 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
DWR 3-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301334003 17092 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
THE PERFECT "10" 1-10A1 10 010S 010W 4301330935 9461 14-20-H62-3855 OW
BADGER-SAM HU MONGUS1-15A1 15 010S 010W 4301330949 9462 14-20-H62-3860 OW P
MAXIMILLIAN-UTE14-1 14 010S 030W 4301330726 8437 14-20-H62-3868 OW P
FRED BASSETT 1-22A1 22 010S 010W 4301330781 9460 14-20-H62-3880 OW
UTETRIBAL1-30Z1 30 010N 010VV 4301330813 9405 14-20-H62-3910 OVV P
UTE LB 1-13A3 13 010S 030W 4301330894 9402 14-20-H62-3980 OW P
UTE2-22B6 22 020S 060VV 4301331444 11641 14-20-H62-4614 OVV P
UINTA QURAY 1-1A3 01 010S 030W 4301330132 5540 14-20-H62-4664 OW P
UTE 1-6D6 06 040S 060W 4301331696 12058 14-20-H62-4752 0W
UTE2-11D6 11 040S 060VV 4301350179 17667 1420H624801 OVV P
LÏÑï1-15D6 15 040S 060VV 4301330429 10958 14-20-H62-4824 OVV P
UTE2-15D6 15 040S 060W 4301334026 17193 14-20-H624824 OW
HILL3-24C6 24 030S 060VV 4301350293 18020 1420H624866 OVV P C
BARCLAYUTE 2-24C6R 24 030S 060W 4301333730 16385 14-20-H62-4866 OW P
BROTHERSON 1-2B4 |02 020S 040W 4301330062 1570 FEE OW P
BOREN 1-24A2 24 010S 020W 4301330084 5740 FEE _ 0W
FARNSWORTH 1-13BS 13 020S 050W 4301330092 1610 FEE OW P
BROADHEAD 1-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301330100 1595 FEE OW P
ASAYEJ 1-20A1 20 010S 010VV 4301330102 8304 FEE OVV P
HANSONTRUST 1-5B3 05 020S 030W 4301330109 1635 FEE OW P
ELLSO/ORTH1-8B4 08 020S 040VV 4301330112 1655 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-9B4 09 020S 040VV 4301330118 1660 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-17B4 17 020S 040VV 4301330126 1695 FEE OVV P
CHANDLER1-5B4 05 020S 040VV 4301330140 1685 FEE OVV P
HANSON1-32A3 32 010S 030VV 4301330141 1640 FEE OVV P
JESSEN 1-17A4 17 010S 040VV 4301330173 4725 FEE OVV P



El Paso E3 Company, LP. (N3065) to EP Energy E3 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

JENKINS1-1B3 01 020S 030VV 4301330175 1790 FEE O¾V P
GOODRICH 1-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301330182 1765 FEE OW P
ELLSVVORTH1-19B4 19 020S 040VV 4301330183 1760 FEE ONV P
O(TYLE1-10B3 10 020S 030VV 4301330187 1810 FEE OVV P
JOS. SMITH1-17C5 17 iO30S 050W 4301330188 5510 FEE OW
RUDY 1-11B3 11 020S 030W \43013302041820 FEE OW
CROCu(1-BB4 06 020S 040VV 4301330213 1825 FEE OVV P
HUNT1-21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301330214 1840 FEE OVV P
LAVVRENCE1-30B4 30 020S 040VV 4301330220 1845 FEE ONV P
YOUNK31-29B4 29 020S 040VV 4301330246 1791 FEE 04V P
GRIFFITHS1-33B4 33 020S 040W 4301330288 4760 FEE OW
PCrrTER1-2B5 02 020S 050VV 4301330293 1826 FEE DVV P
BRCITHERSCR41-26B4 26 020S 040VV 4301330336 1856 FEE ONV P
SADIEMBLANK1-33Z1 33 010N 010VV 4301330355 765 FEE OVV P
PCFEFER 1-24B5 24 020S 050VV 4301330356 1730 FEE O\N P
VVHITEHELAD1-22A3 22 010S: 030VV 4301330357 1885 FEE OVV P
CHASELMILLER2-1A2 01 010S 0200/ 4301330360 5830 FEE OWI P
ELDER1-13B2 13 020S 020VV 4301330366 1905 FEE OVV P
BROTHERSON 2-10B4 10 020S 040W 4301330443 1615 FEE OW P
FARNSWORTH 2-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301330470 1935 FEE OW P
TEVV1-15A3 15 010S 030VV 4301330529 1945 FEE OVV P
UTEFEE2-20C5 20 030S 050VV 4301330550 4527 FEE ONV P
FN3USTCad1-34Z1 34 010N 010VV 4301330566 885 FEE OVV P
GALLOVVAY1-18B1 18 020S 010VV 4301330575 2365 FEE OVV P
SMfTH1-31B5 31 020S 050VV 4301330577 1955 FEE OVV P
LEBEAU 1-34A1 34 010S 010W 4301330590 1440 FEE OW P
LINMAR1-19B2 19 020S 020VV 4301330600 9350 FEE O\N P
AflSSE1-28Z1 28 010N 010VV 4301330609 905 FEE ONV P
POVVELL1-21B1 21 020S 010VV 4301330621 910 FEE OVV P
HANSEN 1-24B3 24 020S 030VV 4301330629 2390 FEE OVV P
OhAAN2-4B4 04 020S 040VV 4301330645 9125 FEE OVV P
DYE 1-25Z2 25 010N 020W 4301330659 9111 FEE OW
HMARTIN 1-21Z1 21 010N 010VV 4301330707 925 FEE OVV P
JENSEN 1-29Z1 29 010N 010W 4301330725 9110 FEE OW P
CHASEL2-17A1V 17 010S 010VV 4301330732 9112 FEE OVV P
BIRCHELL 1-27A1 27 010S 010W 4301330758 940 FEE OW P
CHRISTENSEN2-8B3 08 020S 030W 4301330780 9355 FEE OW
LAMICQ2-SB2 05 020S 020W 4301330784 2302 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 2-14B4 14 020S 040W 4301330815 10450 FEE OW P
WRJRRAA'3-2A2 02 010S 020VVl4301330816 9620 FEE OVV P
HORROCKS2-20A1 V 20 010S 010W 4301330833 8301 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON2-2B4 02 020S 040W 4301330855 8420 FEE ÒV\Ï P
ELLSVVORTH2-8B4 08 020S 040VV 4301330898 2418 FEE OVV P
Òhi4N2-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301330904110045 FEE OVV P
BELCHER2-33B4 33 020S 040VV4301330907 9865 FEE OVV P
BROTHERSON 2-35B5 35 020S 050W 4301330908 9404 FEE OW
HORROCKS 2-4A1 T 04 010S 010W 4301330954 9855 FEE OW P
JENSEN2-29A5 29 010S 050VV4301330974 10040 FEE OVV P
UTE2-34A4 34 010S 040VV 4301330978 10070 FEE OVV P
CHANDLER2-5B4 05 020S 040VV 4301331000 10075 FEE OVV
BABCOCK2-1284 12 020S 040VV 4301331005 10215 FEE OW/ P
BADGER MR BOOM BOOM 2-29A1 29 010S 010W 4301331013 9463 FEE OW
BLEAJAARD2-18B4 18 020S 040VV4301331025 1566 FEE OVV P
BROADHEAD 2-32B5 32 020S 050W 4301331036 10216 FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-1684 16 0208 040W 43013Š1046 10217 FEE OW
RUST3-4B3 04 020S 030VV4301331070 1576 FEE OVV P
HANSON TRUST 2-32Äi 3i 030W 4ŠÕT331072154T ËËË ÒŸÏ P
BROTHElfSOffž-fiŠÀ 02ÕŠÏ040W 4301331078 1541 FEE OW P



El Paso E4 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E4 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HANSONTRUST2-5B3 05 020S 0309/ 4301331079 1636 FEE ONV P
BROTHERSON 2-15B4 15 020S 040W 4301331103 1771 FEE OW P
MONSEN2-27A3 27 010S 030W 4301331104 1746 FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-19B4 19 020S 040W 4301331105 1761 FEE OW P
HUNT2-;21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301331114 1839 FEE OVV P
JENKINS2-1B3 _ 01 020S 030W 4301331117 1792 FEE OW P
PCTTTER2-24BS 24 020S 050VV4301331118 1731 FEE OVV P
POVVELL2-13A2 K 13 010S 020VV 4301331120 8306 FEE OVV P
JENKINS 2-12B3 12 020S 030W 4301331121 10459 FEE OW P
MURDCK3K2-26B5 26 020S 050VV 4301331124 1531 FEE O\N P
BIRCH 3-27B5 27 020S 050W 4301331126 1783 FEE OW P
ROBB 2-2985 29 020S 050W 4301331130 10454 FEE OW P
LAKEFORK2-13B4 13 020S 040VV 4301331134 10452 FEE OVV P
DUNCAN 3-1A2 K 01 010S 020W 4301331135 10484 FEE OW P
HAJ4SON2-983 09 0208; 030VV 4301331136 10455 FEE O\N P
ELLSVIORTH2-9B4 09 0208 040VV 4301331138 10460 FEE OVV P
UTE2-31A2 31 010S 020VV 4301331139 10458 FEE OVV P
POVVELL2-19A1 K 19 010S 010VV 4301331149 8303 FEE OVV P
CEDAR RIM 8-A 22 030S 060W 4301331171 10666 FEE OW P
POTTER 2-684 06 0208 040W 4301331249 11038 FEE OW P
MILES2-1B5 Oi 020S 050W 4301331257 11062 FEE ÒW
MILES2-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301331261 11102 FEE OW P
MONSEN 2-22A3 22 010S 030W 4301331265 11098 FEE OW P
M/RK3HT2-13B5 13 020S 050VV 4301331267 11115 FEE VV P
TODD2-21A3 21 010S 030W 4301331296 11268 FEE OW P
VVElit4RT2-29B4 3Ï 020S 040VV 4301331298 11332 FEE lOVV P
YOUNG2-15A3 15 010S 030W 4301331301 11344 FEE
CHRISTENSEN2-29A4 29 010S 040VV 4301331303 11235 FEE O\N I
BLEAZARD2-28B4 28 020S 040W 4301331304 11433 FEE OW P
REARY2-17A3 17 010S 030W 4301331318 11251 FEE OW P
LAZYK2-11B3 11 020S 030VV 4301331352 11362 FEE OVV P
LAZYK 2-14B3 14 020S 030W 4301331354 11452 FEE OW
MifFTHEVVS2-13B2 13 020S 020VV 4301331357 11374 FEE OVV P
LAKEFORK 3-15B4 15 020S 040W 4301331358 11378 FEE OW
STEVENSCHM3-29A3 29 010S 030VV 4301331376 11442 FEE CAN P
MEEKS3-883 08 020S 0300/ 4301331377 11489 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH3-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301331389 11488 FEE OVV P
DUNCAN5-13A2 13 010S 020VV 4301331516 11776 FEE CNV P
CAÑL3-17C5 17 030S 050VV 4301332112 12476 FEE OiN P
BROTHERSON2-24B4 24 020S 040?! 4301332695 14652 FEE O¾V P
BCH3RERO2-15B3 15 020S 030VV 4301332755 14750 FEE ONV P
BROTHERSON2-25B4 25 020S 040W 4301332791 15044 FEE OW P
CABINLAND2-1683 16 020S 030W 4301332914 15236 FEE OW P
KATHERINE 3-29B4 29 020S 040W 4301332923 15331 FEE OW P
SHRINERS2-10C5 10 030S 050W 4301333008 15908 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON2-26B4 26 020S 040W 4301333139 17047 FEE OW P
MORTENSEN 4-32A2 32 010S 020W 4301333211 15720 FEE OV\Ï
FERRARINI 3-2784 020S 040W 4301333265 15883 FEE OW P
RHOADES2-25B5 25 020S 050W 4301333467 16046 FEE OW P
CASE2-31B4 31 020S 040VV 4301333548 16225 FEE OVV P
ANDERSON-ROWLEY 2-24B3 2_4 020S 030W 4301333616 16284 FEE P
SPROUSE BOWDEN2-18B1 18 020S 010W 4301333808 16677 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 3-11B4 11 020S 040W 4301333904 16891 FEE OW
KOFFORD2-36B5 36 020S 050VV 4301333988 17048 FEE O\N P
ALLEN 3-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301334027 17166 FEE OW
BOURNAKIS3-18B4 18 020S 040VV 4301334091 17264 FEE |3f! P
MILES3-12B5 12 020S 050VV 4301334110 17316 FEE OVV P
OWL and HAWK 2-31B5 31 020S 050W 4301334123 17388 FEE OW P



El Paso E5 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E5 Company, LP. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

OWL and°HAWK 4-17C5 17 030S 050W 4301334193 17387 FEE OW P
DVVR3-32B5 32 020S 050VV 4301334207 17371 FEE C¾V P
LAKEFORKRANCH 3-2284 22 0208 040W 4301334261 17409 FEE OW P
HANSON3-9B3 09 020S 030VI 4301350065 17570 FEE OVV P
DYE2-28A1 28 010S 010VV 4301350066 17531 FEE O\¾ P
MEEKS3-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301350069 17605 FEE ONV P
HANSC‡J4-8B3 08 020S 030VV 4301350088 17571 FEE OVV rP C
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-14B4 14 020S 040W 4301350097 17484 FEE OW P
ALLEN 3-9B4 09 020S 040W 4TÕŒ55ÏžŠ17656 FEE W
HORROCKS4-20A1 20 010S 010W 4301350155 17916 FEE OW
HURLEY2-33A1 33 010S 010VV 4301350166 17573 FEE ONV P
HUTCHINS/CHIODO3-20C5 20 030S 050W 4301350190 17541 FEE OW
ALLEN3-8B4 08 020S 0409/ 4301350192 17622 FEE OVV P
OWILandHAVVK3-10C5 10 030S 050VV 4301350193 17532 FEE OMt P
ÒWÏ.and HAWK 3-19CS 19 030S 050W 4301350201 17508 FEE OW P
EL PASO 4-29B5 29 020S 050W 4301350208 17934 FEE OW C
DONIHUE3-20C6 20 030S 060VV 4301350270 17762 FEE OVV P
FUMMSON3-5B3 05 020S 030VV 4301350275 17725 FEE 04V P C
SPRATT 3-26B5 26 020S 050W 4301350302 17668 FEE OW P
REBEL3-35B5 35 020S 050VV 4301350388 17911 FEE O¾V P C
FREEMAN 4-1684 16 020S 040W 4301350438 17935 Fee OW P
VVILSON3-36B5 36 020S 050VV 4301350439 17936 Fee ONV P C
ELPASO3-21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301350474 18123 Fee 04V P C
IORIGat-12B3 12 020S 030VV 4301350487 17981 Fee O\N P C
CONOVER3-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301350526 18122 Fee OW P C
ROVVLEY3-16B4 16 020S 040VV 4301350569 18151 Fee OVV P C
POTTS 3-1483 14 020S 030W 4301350570 18366 Fee OW P C
FN3TTER4-27B5 27 020S 050VV 4301350571 99999 Fee CNV P C
EL PASO 4-21B4 21 020S 040W 4301350572 18152 Fee OW
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-26B4 26 020S 040W 4301350707 18270 Fee OW C
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-25B4 25 020S 040W 4301350711 18220 Fee OW P C
LAKEFK)RKFLANCH4-23B4 23 020S 040VV 4301350713 18271 Fee CNV P C
LAKEFORKRANCH4-15B4 15 020S 040VV 4301350715 18314 Fee OVV P C
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-24B4 24 020S 040W 4301350716 18269 Fee OW P C
GOLINSKI1-8C4 08 030S 040?! 4301350986 18301 Fee 04V P C
JFU3BERTSON 1-1B1 01 020S 01044 4304730174 5370 FEE C4V P
TIMOTiff1-8B1E 08 020S 010E 4304730215 1910 FEE OVV P
MAGDALENEPAPADOPULOS 1-34A1E 34 010S 010E 4304730241 785 FEE OW P
NELSON1-3tA1E 31 010S 010E 4304730671 830 FEE OVV P
ROSEMARY LLOYD1-24A1E 24 010S 010E 4304730707 840 FEE OW P
HD LANDY1-30A1E O 010S 010E 4304730790 845 FEE OW P
WALKER1-14A1E 14 010S 010E 4304730805 855 FEE OW P
BOLTON2-29A1E 29 010S 010E 4304731112 900 FEE OW P
PRESCCAT1-35Z1 kÏ 010N 010VV 4304731173 1425 FEE OVV P
BISEL GURR 11-1 11 010S 010W 4304731213 8438 FEE OW
UTETRIBAL2-22A1E 22 010S 010E 4304731265 915 FEE OVV P
L. BOLTON 1-12A1 12 010S 010W 4304731295 920 FEE OW P
FOWLES1-26A1 26 010S 010W 4304731296 930 FEE OVV
BRADLEY23-1 23 010S 010W 4304731297 8435 FEE OW P
BASTIAN 1-2A1 02 010S 010W 4304731373 Ì36 ËE ÃÏ
DR LONGž-15A1Ë i 010S 010E 4Š0ÀÌ314709ŠÕŒÏ ËË ÄÏ
DMCK3N1-23Z1 23 010N 010VV 4304731479 10310 FEE O\N P
O MOON 2-26Z1 26 010N 010W 4304731480 10135 FEE OW
LILAD2-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304731797 10790 FEE OVV P
LANDY2-30A1E 30 010S 010E 4304731895 11127 FEE OVV P
VVINNP2-3B1E 03 0206: 010E 4304732321 11428 FEE OiN P
BISEL-GURR 2-11A1 11 010S 010W 4304735410 14428 FEE OW P
FLYlNGJFEE2-12A1 12 010S 010VV 4304739467 16686 FEE OVV P



El Paso E6 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E6 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HARVEST FELLOWSHIP CHURCH2-14B1 020S 010W 4304739591 16546 FEE OW P
OBERHANSLY 3-11A1 _ 010S 010W 4304739679 17937 FEE OW
DUNCAN 2-34A1 34 010S 010W 4304739944 17043 FEE OW P
BISEL GURR 4-11A1 11 010S 010W 4304739961 16791 FEE OW
KILLIAN3-12A1 12 010S: 010VV 4304740226 17761 ML39760 O\N P
WAINOCO ST 1-1ÀB 020S 010W 4304730818 1420 ML-24306-A OW
UTAH ST UTE 1-35A1 35 010S 010W 4304730182 5520 ML-25432 OW
ST/VTE 1-19A4 19 0106; 040VV 4301330322 9118 ML-27912 OiN P
FEDERAL 2-28E19E 28 OSOS 190E 4304732849 12117 UTU-0143512 OW
FEDERAL 1-28E19E 28 050S 190E 4304730175 5680 UTU143512 O\¾ P
BLANCHARD 1-3A2 03 010S 020W 4301320316 5877 FEE OW PA
WH BLANCHARD 2-3A2 03 010S 020W 4301330008 5775 FEE OW PA
YACKU 1-7A1 07 010S 010VV 4301330018 5795 FEE OVV PA
JAAAESPOVVELL3 _ 13 010S 020VV 4301330024 8305 FEE VVD PA
BASTIAN1(3-7D) 07 010S 010VV 4301330026 5800 FEE OLV PA
LAMICQ-URRUTY 1-8A2 08 010S 020W 4301330036 5975 FEE OW_ PA
BLEAJJARD1-18B4 18 020S 040VV 4301330059 11262 FEE OVV PA
OLSEN 1-27A4 27 010S 040VV 4301330064 1565 FEE OVV F%4
EVANS 1-31A4 31 010S 040W 4301330067 5330 FEE OW
HAAABLIN1-26A2 26 010S 020VV 4301330083 2305 FEE OUV _F4
HARTMAN 1-31A3 31 010S 030W 4301330093 10700 FEE OW PA
FARNSWORTH1-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301330097 5725 FEE OW A
POVVELL1-33A3 33 010S 030VV 4301330105 4526 FEE OVV 44
LOTRIDGEGATES 1-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301330117 1625 FEE OW
REMINGTON 1-34A3 34 010S 030W 4301330139 1670 FEE OW
ANDERSON 1-28A2 28 010S 020W 4301330150 5895 FEE OW
RHOADESMOON 1-35B5 35 020S 050W 4301330155 5270 FEE OW PA
JC44N 1-3B2 03 020S 020VV 4301330160 5765 FEE O\N
SMITH 14C5 06 030S 050VV 4301330163 5385 FEE OVV F44
HORRCK3KSFEE 1-3A1 03 010S 010VV 4301330171 5505 FEE OVV !¾4
VVARREN1-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301330174 9139 FEE CAV PA
JENSENFENZEL1-20C5 20 030S 050VV 4301330177 4730 FEE ONV PA
MNTilNRANCH1-13B4 13 020S 040VV 4301330180 4524 FEE OVV PA
BFKITHERSON 1-27B4 27 020S 040VV 4301330185 1775 FEE OVV PA
JENSEN 1-31AS 31 010S 050VV 4301330186 4735 FEE OVV 144
ROBERTSON 1-29A2 29 010S 020W 4301330189 4740 FEE OW Ä
VVINKLER1-28A3 28 010S 030VV 4301330191 5465 FEE ONV PA
CHENEY1-33A2 33 010S 020VV 4301330202 1750 FEE O¾V 144
J LAMICQSTATE 1-681 06 020S 010W 4301330210 5730 FEE OW PA
REESEESTATE1-10B2 10 020S 020VV 4301330215 5700 FEE OlVV I¾\
REEDER1-17B5 17 020S 050VV 4301330218 5460 FEE O\N PA
ROBERTSONUTE 1-2B2 02 020S 020W 4301330225 1710 FEE OW A
HATCH1-5B1 05 020S 010VV 4301330226 5470 FEE OVV PA
BROTHERSON1-22B4 22 020S 040VV 4301330227 5935 FEE OVV PA
ALLRED1-16A3 16 010S 030VV 4301330232 1780 FEE OVV 144
BIRCH1-35A5 35 010S 0509/ 4301330233 9116 FEE OVV 4
MARQUERITEUTE 1-882 08 020S 020W 4301330235 9122 FEE OW A
BU22I1-11B2 11 020S 020VV4301330248 6335 FEE 01N 44
SHISLER 1-3B 03 020S 010VV4301330249 5960 FEE OW A
TEW 1-1B5 01 020S 050W 4301330264 5580 FEE OW Ã
EVANSUTE 1-19B3 020S 030W 4301330265 1870 FEE OW PA
SHELL2-27A4 N 010S 1040W 4301330266 1776 FEE WD PA
DYE1-29A1 29 010S 010VV 4301330271 99990 FEE OVV 144
\/ODAUTE 1-‡C5 0.4 030S 050VV4301330283 4530 FEE 09V PA
BROTHERSON 1-28A4 010S 040W 4301330292 9114 FEE OW PA
MEAGHER 1-4B2 04 020S 020W 4301330313 8402 FEE OW PA
NORLING 1-9B1 020S 010W 4301330315 1811 FEE OW Ä
S. BROADHEAD 1-9C5 09 030S 050W 4301330316 5940 FEE OW PA



El Paso E7 Company, LP. (N3065) to EP Energy E7 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

TIh&DTHY1-09A3 09 010S 030VV 4301330321 10883 FEE 04V PA
BARRETT 1-34A5 34 010S 050W 4301330323 9115 FEE OW PA
MEAGHER TRIBAL 1-9B2 09 020S 020W 4301330325 9121 FEE OW PA
PHILLIPSUTE 1-3C5 03 030S 050W 4301330333 1816 FEE OW PA
ELLSWIORTH1-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301330351 6375 FEE ONV PA
LAVVSC‡J1-28A1 28 010S 010VV 4301330358 5915 FEE OVV PA
An ES1-23A4 23 010S 040VV 4301330375 1901 FEE OVV PA
HORROCKS1-6A1 06 010S 010W 4301330390 5675 FEE OW PA
SHRINE HOSPITAL 1-10C5 10 0308 050W 4301330393 5565 FEE OW Pi
GOODRICH 1-1882 18 020S 020VV 4301330397 5485 FEE O\N PA
SVVDPOVVELL3 13 010S 020VV 4301330478 10708 FEE VVD PA
BODRERO1-15B3 15 020S 030W 4301330565 4534 FEE OW
AkOC‡4TRIBAL1-30C4 30 030S 040VV 4301330576 2360 FEE ONV PA
DUNCAN2-9B5 09 020S 050VV 4301330719 5440 FEE ONV PA
FISHER1-16A4 16 010S 040VV 4301330737 2410 FEE ONV PA
URRUTY2-34A2 34 010S 020VV 4301330753 9117 FEE ONV PA
GiOODRICH1-24A4 24 010S 040VV 4301330760 2415 FEE 04V PA
CARLSMITH2-25A4 25 0108 040VV 4301330776 9136 FEE 04V PA
ANDERSC‡J1-A30B1 30 020S 010VV 4301330783 9137 FEE OVV PA
CADILLAC3-6A1 06 010S 010W 4301330834 6316 FEE OW PA
MCELPRANG 2-31A1 31 010S 010W 4301330836 8439 FEE OW A
REESE ESTATE 2-10B2 10 020S 020W 4301330837 2417 FEE OW
CLARK2-9A3 09 010S 030W 4301330876 2416 FEE OW PA
JENKINS3-16A3 16 010S 030VV 4301330877 9790 FEE ONV PA
CHRISTENSEN2-26AS 26 010S 050VV 4301330905 10710 FEE ONV PA
FORD2-36A5 36 010S 050VV 4301330911 9630 FEE O¾V PA
MORTENSEN 2-32A2 32 010S 02OW 4301330929 9486 FEE OW PA
M/ILKERSON 1-20Z1 20 010N 010VV 4301330942 5452 FEE ONV PA
UTE TRIBAL 2-4A3 S 04 010S 030W 4301330950 10230 FEE OW
OBERHANSLY2-31Z1 31 010N 010VV 4301330970 9262 FEE Ï>Al I¾\
MORRIS2-TA3 07 010S 030VV 4301330977 9725 FEE ONV PA
POVVELL2-08A3 08 010S 030VV4301330979 10175 FEE OVV PA
FISHER24A3 06 010S 030VV 4301330984 10110 FEE OVV PA
JACOBSEN2-12A4 2 010S 040VV 4301330985 10480 FEE OVV PA
CHENEY2-33/G 33 010S 020VV 4301331042 10313 FEE OVV PA
HANSON TRUST 2-29A3 29 010S 030W 4301331043 5306 FEE OW PA
BURTON2-15B5 15 020S 050VV 4301331044 10205 FEE OVV PA
ËÃh4NS-UTE2-1783 17 020S 030VV 4301331056 10210 FEE LDVV PA
ELLSVVORTH2-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301331090 5336 FEE 04V !%4
REMINGTON 2-34A3 34 010S 030W 4301331091 1902 FEE OW PA
VVINKLER2-28A3 28 010S 030VV 4301331109 4519 FEE O\¾ PA
TEVV2-10B5 10 020S 050VV 4301331125 1751 FEE ONV PA
LIND6WAY2-33A4 33 010S 040VV 4301331141 1756 FEE OVV PA
FIELDSTED2-28A4 28 010S 040VV 4301331293 10665 FEE OVV PA
POWELL 4-13A2 13 010S 020W 4301331336 11177 FEE GW PA
DUMP2-20A3 20 010S 030W 4301331505 11691 FEE OW PA
SMITH2X-23C7 23 0308 070VV 4301331634 12382 FEE D PA
MORTENSEN 3-32A2 32 010S 020W 4301331872 11928 FEE OW PA
TODDUSA ST 1-2B1 02 020S 010W 4304730167 99998 FEE OW PA
STATE1-7B1E 07 020S 010E 4304730180 5555 FEE OW
BACON1-10B1E 10 020S 010E 4304730881 5550 FEE ONV PA
PARIETTEDRAW 28-44 28 040S 010E 4304731408 4537 FEE OW PA
REYNOLDS2-7B1E 07 020S 010E 4304731840 4960 FEE OW PA
STATE2-35A2 35 010S 020W 4301330156 4715 ML-22874 OW PA
UTAH STATE LB 1-11B1 11 020S 010W 4304730171 5530 ML-23655 OW PA
STATE1-8A3 08 010S 030W 4301330286 5655 ML-24316 OW A
UTAHFEDERAL1-24B1 24 020S 010W 4304730220 590 ML-26079 OW PA
CEDAR RIM 15 34 030S 060W 4301330383 6395 14-20-462- 29 OW S



El Paso E8 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E8 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE TRIBAL2-24C7 24 030S 070W 4301331028 10240 14-20-H62-1135 OW S
CEDARRIM12 28 030S 060W 4301330344 6370 14-20-H62-1323 OW IS
CEDARRIM16 33 030S 060W 4301330363 6390 14-20-H62-1328 OW S
SPRING HOLLOW 2-34Z3 34 010N 030W 4301330234 5255 14-20-H62-1480 OW S
E3/ANSUTE1-17B3 17 020S 030VV 4301330274 5335 14-20-H62-1733 OVV S
UTE JENKS 2-1-B4 G 01 020S 040W 4301331197 10844 14-20-H62-1782 OW S
LffE3-12B3 12 020S 030VV 4301331379 11490 14-20-H62-1810 OVV S
UTE TRIBAL9-4B1 04 020S 010W 4301330194 5715 14-20-H62-1969 OW S
UTE TRIBAL 2-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301331424 11615 14-20-H62-2489 OW S
UTE 1-33B6 33 020S 060W 4301330441 1230 14-20-H62-2493 OW S
UTE2-22B5 22 0206; 050VV 4301331122 10453 14-:20-H62-2509 O\N S
UTE1-1881E 18 020S 010E 4304730969 9135 14-20-H62-2864 O\¾ S
LAUREN UTE 1-23A3 23 010S 030W 4301330895 9403 14-20-H62-3981 OW S
UTE 2-28B6 28 020S 060W 4301331434 116i4 14-20-H62-4622 OW S
UTE 1-27B6X 27 020S 060W 4301330517 11166 14-20-H62-4631 OW S
UTE2-27B6 27 020S 060VV 4301331449 11660 14-20-H62-4:331 ONV S
CEDAR RIM10-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330328 6365 14-20-H62-4724 OW 5
UTE 5-30A2 30 010S 020W 4301330169 5910 14-20-H62-4863 OW S
UTE TRIBAL G-1 (1-24C6) 24 030S 060W 4301330298 4533 14-20-H62-4866 OW S
UTE TRIBAL FEDERAL 1-30C5 30 030S 050W 4301330475 665 14-20-H62-4876 OW S
SMB1-10A2 10 010S 020VV 4301330012 5865 FEE OVV S
KENDALL1-12A2 12 010S 020VV 4301330013 5875 FEE ONV S
CEDARRIM2 20 030S 060VV .4301330019 6315 FEE ONV S
URRUTY 2-9A2 09 010S 020W 4301330046 5855 FEE OW S
BROTHERSON 1-14B4

J¯
ÕžÕŠ040W

4301330Ò5
1̄535 FEE OW

RUST1-4B3 04 020S 030VV 4301330063 1575 FEE OVV S
WK3NSEN1-21A3 21 010S 030VV4301330082 1590 FEE O\¾ S
BFKITHERSCRM1-10B4 10 020S 040VV 4301330110 1614 FEE ONV S
FÄRNSWORTH 1-12B5 12 020S 050W 4301330124 1645 FEE OW 5
ELLSVIORTH1-16B4 16 020S 040VV .4301330192 1735 FEE ONV S
MARSHALL1-;K)A3 20 010S 030VV 4301330193 9340 FEE OVV S
CHRISTMAN BLAND 1-31B4 31 020S 040W 4301330198 4745 FEE M S
FK)PER1-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301330217 1850 FEE O\¾ S
EUROTHERSO‡l1-24B4 24 020S 040VV 4301330229 1865 FEE OVV S
BFMITHERSCRM1-33A4 33 010S 040VV 4301330272 1680 FEE ONV S
BROTHERSON 1-23B4 23 020S 040W 4301330483 8423 FEE OW S
SMITHALBERT2-8C5 08 030S 050VV 4301330543 5495 FEE OVV S
VODAJOSEPHINE2-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301330553 5650 FEE ONV S
HANSEN1-16B3 16 020S 030VV 4301330617 9124 FEE OVV S
BFMITHERSCR41-25B4 25 020S 040VV 4301330668 9126 FEE 04V S
POWELL 2-33A3 33 010S 030W 4301330704 2400 FEE OW S
BROWN2-28B5 28 020S 050W 4301330718 9131 FEE OW
EULA-UTE1-16A1 16 010S 010VV 4301330782 8443 FEE O\N S
JESSEN 1-15A4 15 010S 040VV 4301330817 9345 FEE ONV S
REK3USTON 1-22Z1 22 010N 010VV 4301330884 936 FEE 04V S
FIELDSTED 2-27A4 27 010S 040W 4301330915 9632 FEE OW S
HANSKUTT 2-23B5 _ 23 020S 050W 4301330917 9600 FEE OW S
TIMOTHY 4-18A3 18 010S 030W 4301330940 9633 FEE OW S
BFKITHERSON2-3B4 03 020S 040VV 4301331008 10165 FEE ONV S
BROTHERSON 2-22B4 22 020S 1040W 4301331086 1782 FEE OW S
MILES2-35A4 35 010S 040W 4301331087 1966 FEE OW S
ELLSWORTH 2-17B4 17 020S 040W 4301331089 1696 FEE OW
RUST 2-36A4 36 010S 040W 4301331092 1577 FEE OW S
E\h4NS2-19B3 19 020S 030VV 4301331113 1777 FEE OiN iS
FARNSWORTH 2-12BS 12 020S 050W 4301331115 1646 FEE OW S
CHRISTENSEN 3-4B4 04 020S 040W 4301331142 10481 FEE OW Š
ROBERTSON 2-29A2 29 010S 020W ¡430133115010679 , FEE OW S
CEDAR RIM2A näiÏW 4301331172 10671 E OW S



El Paso E9 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E9 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

HARTMAN 2-31A3 31 010S 030W 4301331243 11026 FEE OW S
GOODRICH 2-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301331246 11037 FEE OW 'S
JESSEN2-:21A4 21 0106; 040VV 4301331256 11061 FEE C\N S
BROTHERSON3-23B4 23 020S 040W 4301331289 11141 FEE OW S
MYRIN FDANCH2-18B3 18 020S 030VV 4301331297 11475 FEE CAN S
BROTHERSON2-2B5 02 020S 050W 4301331302 11342 FEE OW S
DASTRUP2-30A3 30 010S 030VV 4301331320 11253 FEE 04V S
YOUNK32-30B4 30 020S 040VV 4301331366 11453 FEE ONV S
lOFK32-10B3 10 020S 030VV 4301331388 11482 FEE OVV S
WK3NSEN3-27A3 27 010S 030VV 4301331401 11686 FEE O\¾ S
HORROC‡092-5B1E 05 020S 010E 4304732409 11481 FEE CAN S
I-4RSEN1-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304730552 815 FEE OVV TA
DRYGULCH1-36A1 36 010S 0100/ 4304730569 820 FEE ONV TA



RECEIVED: May. 30, 2013

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 HANSON 2-9B3 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43013311360000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1531 FSL 1461 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 09 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

5 /31 /2013

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  pump change

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 POOH w/rods & pump Acidize existing perfs w/ 7,500 gal 15% HCl. RIH
w/ pump and rod string Clean location and resume production

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Lisa Morales 713 997-3587

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 5 /30 /2013

June 12, 2013

Sundry Number: 38291 API Well Number: 43013311360000Sundry Number: 38291 API Well Number: 43013311360000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well HANSON 2-9B3

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY,L.P. 43013311360000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1531 FSL 1461 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESW Section: 09 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

/ ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

5/31/2013
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENTREPORT DEEPEN FRACTURETREAT NEWCONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: pump change

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

POOH w/rods & pump Acidize existing perfs w/ 7,500 gal 15% HCI. RIH Approved by the
w/ pump and rod string Clean location and resume production utah Division of

OFI, Gas and Mining

Date: June 12, 2013

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Lisa Morales 713 997-3587 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/30/2013

RECEIVED: May. 30,



RECEIVED: Jun. 19, 2013

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 HANSON 2-9B3 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43013311360000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1531 FSL 1461 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 09 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

6 /20 /2013

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 EP plans to acidize perforations with 30000 gals 15% HCL.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038

TITLE
 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 6 /19 /2013

June 20, 2013

Sundry Number: 39188 API Well Number: 43013311360000Sundry Number: 39188 API Well Number: 43013311360000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well HANSON 2-9B3

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY,L.P. 43013311360000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1531 FSL 1461 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESW Section: 09 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

/ ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

6/20/2013
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENTREPORT DEEPEN FRACTURETREAT NEWCONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EP plans to acidize perforations with 30000 gals 15% HCL. Approved by the
Utah Division of

OFI, Gas and Mining

Date: June 20, 2013

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 6/19/2013

RECEIVED: Jun. 19,
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