
Fonn OGC-la SUBMIT IN IPLICATE*
STATE OF UTAH (Other instructíons on

reverse side)
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

Fee
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL, DEEPEN, OR PLUG BACK 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

la. Type of Work
7. Unit Agreement NameDRILLU DEEPEN

[¯]
PLUG BACK O

h. Type of Well
Oil Gas Single Multiple 8. Farm or Lease Name
Well Well Other Zone Zone

2. Name of Operator Lake Fork
Utex Oil Compan,y " "°

3. Address of Operator 2-13B4
1245 E. Brickyard Road, Suite 600, Salt Lak 84106 Field and P'ool, or Wildcat

4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State Al tamont
At surface

11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk.

963' FWL 819' FSL """ """'°r area
At proposed prod. zone OCT0 2 198g Sec. 13, T2S, R4WUSM

14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parrish 13. State

4 miles south of Altamont Utah N CE OI Duchesne Utah
15. Distance from proposed* 16. N se L 17. No. of acres assigned

location to nearest a j to this well
property or lease line, ft 640(Also to nearest drig. Iine, if any)

18. Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed depth 20. Rotary or cable tools
to nearest well, drilling, completed,
or applied for, on this lease, ft. 13,300 Rotary

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 22. Approx. date work will start*

6,159' GR October 20, 1985
28

PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

Size of Hole Size of Casing Weight per Foot Setting Depth Quantity of Cement

12 1/4" 9 5/8" 36# 5,000 circulate to surface
8 3/4" 7" 26# 10,400 as necessary
6 1/8" 5" 18# 13,300 as necessary

Utex controls the land within 660' of the well location

APPROVED BY THE STiTEFIDONC OF UTAHDIVISION OF
OIL, GAS A INING

Water Permit # 43-9592 LLSPAdlNG:
IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM: If proposal is to deepen or plug back, give data on present productive zone and proposed new pro-
ductive zone. If proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give pertinent data on subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths. Give blowout

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Permit No......................... . ............... Approval Date ......

Approved by.................................. ................ Title..................----.. .. . ............... Date.........
Conditions of approval, if any:

*See Instructions On Reverse



LOCAT IN THE SW¾ OF THE SW¾ OF

UTEX 0/L COMPANY SECTION 13, T2S, R4W, U.S.B.&M.

WELL COCAT/0N PLAT
LAKE FORK - S

N TH

/3

SCALE:l"=lOOO'

o BROTHERSOY 2-/384
GROUND El.EV. 6/39'

963'

WEST 263/.34'

LEGEND & NOTES SURVEYOR'S CERT/F/CATE

# ORIGINAL STONE CORNERS FOUND I hereby certify that this plat was prepared
AND USED BY THIS SURVEY. frOm field notes of an actual survey

performed by me, during which the shown
monuments were found or established.

SHEEDGENRERRAELFELNDCEæAFNECAPL

ULAT ONS .

f ry D IIred, Registered Land
urveyor, Cert. No. 3817 (Utah)

JERRY D. ALLRED& ASSOCIATES
Surveying & Engineering consultants

121 North Center Street
P.O. Drawer C

DUCHESNE, UTAH 84021
19 Se pt .

' 85 79-121-095
.

(801)



à e
ONSITE PREDRILL INSPECTIONFORM

COlf ANYUter Oil. Co. WELLNO. Bret-hemen 2-13B4

Sw/Sw
LOCATION: SECTION 13 TOWNSHIP2s RANGE 4w COUNTYDuchesne

LEASENO. ONSITE INSPECTION DATE 9/27/85

(A) PERSONS IN ATTENDANCEJimmie Thompson-DOGM,,Glenn Goodwin-DOGM

John Fauset- Dirt contractor

(B) SURFACEFORMATIONAND CHARACTERISTICS Uinta, sand and clay

(C) BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF VEGETATIONCedar trees, sage brush and very little

grass

(D) ARCHAEOLOGICALCLEARANCE: YES OR NO

(E) DESCRIPTION OF TOPOGRAPHY(drainages, slope, roads, etc.) There is a

driinage that runs along the south side of the location and an existing

road that runs east and west.

(F) CONDITIONSFOR APPROVAL:

PIT LINING (YES OR NO) Yes

TYPE OF LINING IF NEEDEDBentonite and natural soil, 2 #s ver foot.

ADDITIONALREQUIREMENTS Cedar trees and saŒe brush wilT be slashed and

mixed with the top soil and an TB" colvert installed in the drainage

SIGNATURE: Jimmie Thompson TITLE Oil & Gas Tield



O O
UTEX OIL COMPANY

SUITE 600
1245 EAST BRICKYARD ROAD
SALT LAKE CITY,UTAHB4106

PHONE (801) 4-2262

September 20, 1985

State of Utah
Department of Natural Resources RECEIVEDDivision of Oil, Gas and Mining
355 West North Temple
3 Triad Center, Suite 350 (NOT02]gggSalt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

Diveau,y UF OIL
GAS & MINING

Gentlemen:

Enclosed please find the following:

1. Triplicate copies of Application for Permit to Drill
the Lake Fork 2-1384 well, located in the SW¾, SWh of
Section 13, Township 2 South, Range 4 West, Duchesne
County, Utah.

2. Triplicate copies of survey plat.
3. Triplicate copies of well layout plat.
4. Triplicate copies of BOP drawing.
5. Triplicate copies of 10 Point Well Prognosis.

We trust this application is complete and in proper form
for your rapid approval of our planned operations. If further
information is required, please contact us at the above address
or telephone number.

We hereby request that this APD and all other information
submitted relative to this well be held confidential for the
maximumallowable period of time.

If I may be of further assistance, please advise.

Sincerely,

D. T. Hansen

DTH/mm



September 30, 1985

UTEXOIL COMPANY
10 Point Well Prognosis

Lake Fork 2-1384

1. Surface formation: Tertiary Uinta Formation

2. Estimated tops of geologic markers: Top Green River 5,800
Top Wasatch 10,600

3. Estimated depths to water, oil and gas or mineral bearing formations:

0-5,800 Uinta - Water bearing
5,800-10,600 Green River - Oil, Gas and Water

10,600 to T.D. Wasatch - Oil, Gas and Water

4. Casing program: Size Weight Grade Depth
9 5/8" 36# J-55 5,000'
7" 26# N-80 10,400'
5" 18# N-80 13,300'

5. Pressure control equipment: See diagram attached to APD.
Blowout preventers: A series 1500, 5000 psi W.P.
hydraulically operated double ram type preventer, with pipe and blind
rams, and a 5000 psi, Hydril type preventer will be used.
A 5,000 psi W.P. hydraulic choke manifold, PVT, and flow sensors will
be used.
Testing Procedure: Before drilling out each casing string, blowout pre-
venters, casing head, and casing will be pressure tested, and blowout
preventers will be checked for proper operation each day.

6. Type and characteristics of proposed circulating medium:
0-5,000 Fresh water with gel sweeps
5,000-10,400 Fresh gel mud lightly treated, water loss controlled

below 7,000'.
10,400-T.D. Fresh gel mud, weighted, treated and dispersed as

necessary.
Approximately 800 barrels of circulating fluid and
adequate bulk barite will be maintained on site.

7. Auxillary Equipment:
Upper and lower kelly cocks will be used, and a full opening valve will
be maintained on the rig floor. A mud logging unit is planned from
7,000' to total depth with 24 hour supervision.

8. Testing and Coring:
No DST's are planned
DIL with S.P. and G.R., FD-CN

9. Anticipated Hazards:
No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No hydrogen
sulfide is present in this area.

10. Anticipated starting date:
October 20, 1985 with duration of operations approximately 90



0 0

UTEX DRILLING CO.

BOP STA CK

ROTARY TABLE KELLY(with lower kelly cock,5OOO Ibs.)

lO" 1500 SERIES 6" 1500 SERIES FLANGE
ROTATING HEAD

ORBIT VALVE
BLOOlE LINE

)
10" 1500 SERIESP I PE RAMS SHAFFER

L i DOUBLE- GATE
BLIND RAMS

3" KILL LINES 3" OPENING FOR CHOKE
SYSTEM, 5000 lbs.

SERIES 1500 EOUlPMENT IS 5000 PS) RATED

NOT TO
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R/GHT- OF-WAY AND USE BOUNDARY SURVEY
LAKE FORK Ë¯/

UTEX O/L COMPANY

USE BOUNDARY DESCRIPTION

Beginning at a point which is North 41°32'53" East 985.05 feet from the Southwest Corner of

Section 13, Township 2 South, Range 4 West of the Uintah Special Base and Meridian;

Thence North 23°54'36" East 400 feet;

Thence South 66°05'24" East 570 feet;

Thence South 23°54'36" West 400 feet;

Thence North 66°05'24" West 570 feet to the Point of Beginning, containing 5.23 acres.

CKITo2 1985

DESCRIPTION OF RIGHT-OF-WAY IN SECTION 13 DiviblON OF Ct
GAS & MININr

A 40 feet wide right-of-way over part of Section 13, Township 2 South, Range 4 West of the
Uintah Special Base and Meridian, the centerline of said right-of-way being further described
as follows:

Beginning at a point on the South line of said Section 13, said point being West 543 feet from
the Southwest Corner of said Section;

Thence North 39°10'29" East 197.8 feet;

Thence North 46°04'ls" East 569.96 feet to the Utex Oil Compang BROTHERSON 2-1384 oil well location,
containing 0.71 acres.

DESCRIPTION OF RIGHT-OF-WAY IN SECTION 24

A 40 feet wide right-of-way over part of Section 24, Township 2 South, Range 4 West of the
Uintah Special Base and Meridian, the centerline of said right-of-way being further described
as follows:

Beginning at a point on the North line of said Section 24, said point being West 543 feet from

the Northwest Corner of said Section;

Thence South 39°10'29" West 300 feet to an existing road, containing 0.28 acres.

SURVEYOR'S CERTIFICATE

This is to certify that under my direct supervision a survey was made of the parcels shown on this
plat and that the monuments indicated were found and that this plat accurately represents said
survey to the best of my knowledge. /' /

Je ry D. llred, Registered Land :

rveyo , Cert . No. 3817 (Utah)

JERRY D. ALLRED & ASSOCIATES
Surveying & Engineering Consultants

121 North Center Street
P.O. Drawer C

DUCHESNE.UTAHB4021
79 á~r/ 36~ 79 /2 & 95 (801)



U TEX 0/L
WELL LAY

LAKE FORK

CBR C21
)C21

DIKE
i lp i STA. 4+60

UEL

aars
--

¿y

GEVERATOR

D/KE /0'

MC D HOUSE
-

HOLE LOCAT/0N RESERVE
¯

/* FROM GROUND Pir -

ELEV OE 6/59
TO F/N/SHED LOCAT/ON

S' DEEPELEV OE6/38'
PtMPs i - BOTTOM ELEVa ¯

6/50
rO/LET

--

FUEL

/ 8 0' 40' I ' i
S TA. 2+30

cia rol

EXCAVAT/0N
P/PE BA5xE S MATER/AL

STOCKP/LE
4 SETS P/PE NACMS

PARK/NG --

AREA

10PSO/L

S TOCKP/L E

A¢CES
ROAD

STA 04-00

E21C3
TANK GRADE
E/.EV 6/7/'.5
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COMRANY RECEWED M

UT PLAT 2Bay
2-/384 arme e,GAS g MININOIL

6/68' -- LÇCAT/JA SUREAÇE

I
IESERVE P/T

I

/ 50' S TA. 4+60

o RESERVE P/T\ /
11

' L _ /
i"- so' STA. 2 30

/"= so' S TA. 0+00

8 i 70 |

6
F/LL

QUANT/T/ES 75' I s'-+-s'd

APPROX/hfATE CUT: /9,/00 ca YDS.
/(EYWAY A A

APPR0X/hfATE E/L L· 37oo cd YDs

JERRY D. ALLRED & ASSOCIATES
Surveying & Engineering Consultants

121 North Center Street
P.O. Drawer C

DUCHESNE, UTAH 84021MBER /983 7 - /2/- O ? 5 tanu



OPERATOR DATE /b -
f-fi'

WELLNAME A - /g/f/

SEC SW .5d /3 T -23 R £4/ COUNTY

API NUMBER TYPE OF LEASE

CHECKOFF:

PLAT BOND
.

NEARESTWELL

LEASE FIELD POTASHOR
OIL SHALE

PROCESS NG COMMENTS:

APPROVALLETTER:

SPACING: A-3 c-3-a /Jf- VA */n/ff

UNIT CAUSENO. & DATE

c-3-b c-3-c

STIPULATIONS:

11/2/84
25020



O
STATEOF UTAH Norman H. Bangerter. Govertar

NATURALRESOURCES Dee C. Hansen, Executive Direciar

Oil, Gas & Mining
Dianne R. Nielson, Ph.D., Division Director

355 W North Temple · 3 Triod Center · Suite 350 Salt Lake City, UT84180-1203· 801-538-5340

October 9, 1985

Utex Oil Company
1245 E. Brickyard Road, Suite 600
Salt Lake City, Utah 84106

Gentlemen:

Re: Well No. Lake Fork 2-13B4 - SW SWSec. 13, T. 2S, R. AW

819' FSL, 963' FWL - Duchesne County, Utah

Approval to drill the above-referenced oil well is hereby granted in

accordance with the Order of Cause No. 139-42 dated April 17, 1985 subject to
the following stipulations:

1. Pit shall be lined with bentonite.

In addition, the following actions are necessary to fully comply with

this approval:

1. Spudding notification to the Division within 24 hours after drilling
operations commence.

2. Submittal to the Division of completed Form OGC-8-X, Report of Water

Encountered Ouring Drilling.

3. Prompt notification to the Division should you determine that it is

necessary to plug and abandon this well. Notify 3ohn R. Baza,
Petroleum Engineer, (Office) (801) 538-5340, (Home) 298-7695, or
R. 3. Firth, Associate Director, (Ebme) 571-6068.

4. Compliance with the requirements and regulations of Rule C-27,

Associated Gas Flaring, General Rules and Regulations, Oil and Gas
Conservation.



Page 2
Utex Oil Company
Well No. Lake Fork 2-1384
October 9, 1985

5. This approval shall expire one (1) year after date of issuance unless
substantial and continuous operation is underway or an application
for an extension is made prior to the approval expiration date.

The API number assigned to this well is 43-013-31134.

Associate Director - Oil &.Gas

as
Enclosures
cc: Branch of Fluid



w/ok

DIVISIONOFOIL,GASANDMINING

SPUDDINGINF0lfiATION API #43-013-31134

NAMEOFCOMPANY:UTEX OIL COMPANY

WELLNAME: LAKE FORK 2-13B4

SECTION SWSW13 TOWNSHIP 2S RANGE 4W COUNTY puchesne

DRILLIN6CONTRACTORHargrock sat nois
RIG#
SPUDDED:DATE 10-24-85

TIME 9;00 AM

ÑOW Dry Hol e Spud

DRILLINGWILLCOMMENCE utex nos ly ing - Rig #3

REPORTEDBY Connie Romero

TELEPHONEÑ 738-5798

DATE 10-24-85 SIGN



Form00C-lb IT IN TRll'l.11.\\\
TATE OF UTAH her inatna lions on

reverse suir )DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5· 'EASE DESIGNATION .tND BERIAL NO.

Fee
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTES OR TRIMS NAMESUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTSON

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or ta deepen or plug back t e .Use "APPLICATION FOR PERhilT-'' for such proposai

1.
oraLLI.

wsLL O o2=== JN 0 2 1986
L UNW AGREEMENT NAME

2. NAME 07 OPERATOR 8. TARM OR LEASE NAME
Utex Oil Company F OlL BKE FORK

_ _ _S. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. WELI. NO.

Suite 600, 1245 East Brickyard Road, Salt Lake City, Utah 2-13B4
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in ace rdance with any State require pents. 10. FIELD AND POOL, 08 WILDCATSee also space 17 below.)at surfac'

Altamont
11. sme.. T., a., M., os aLE. Axo

aCRVET 08 ASSA
963' FWL 819' FSL

Sec 13 T2S R4W USM
14. PEBoilT NO. 15. BLEVATroNs (Show whether Dr. ar, on, etc.) 12. COUNTY 05 PARISH 18. STATE

43-013-31134 6,159' GR Duchesne Utah
1e· CheckAppropnate Bo To IndicateNature of Notice, Report,or OtherData

NOTICS 07 INTENTION TO: BUBasqumNT azPost or:

Tzst WATER SECT•OFT PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPL TE FRACTURE TEEATHENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOuŠlNG OR ACIDizlNG ABANDONMENT*

nerAin wzLI. citANos Pr-ANs (Othe ) Drilling
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel(Other)

- .. (hmpletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)
17. DESCRIBE rituPOSED OR COMPL£TED OPERATIONs (Clearlý state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting anyproposed work. If well is directionally drilled. give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-

nent to this work.) •

SPUDDED WELL AT 8:00 P.M. ON NOVEMBER 14, 1985

November 15, 1985 through November 21, 1985
Drilled from O' to 4,677' in the Dintah formation

November 22, 1985 through November 28, 1985
Drilled from 4,677' to 6,965' in the Uintah formatiori

November 29, 1985 through December 5, 1985
Drilled from 6,965' to 8,713' in the Green River formation

CDNF10ENTIR
Page 1

18. I her ce at the foregoin i true agd rrect

TITT DATE

(This space for Federal or State odice use)

APPMVED BT TITLE DATE
CO2.ou 8 OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse



Form0Gi lb SL \\ TRll'l,16\lF
ATE OF UTAH er instructions on

reverse wic)
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIONATION AND SERIAL NO.

Fee

SUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not use this form for pro osals to drill or to deepen or plus c to a different reservoir.

Use ''APP CATION FOR PERMIT-" for such
1. - ElVED 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

OILLL WABLL
OTHER

2. NAME OF OPERATOR AN22 * '^•"°""""'"'

Utex Oil Company LAKE FORK
3. ADDRESS OF OPSEATOg 9. WEI,I, NO.

Suite 600, 1245 East Brickyard Road, palt Lake C 2-13B4
4. LOCATION or wmLL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State 10. rtBLD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)at surface Altamont
11. SEC.. T., R., M., OR BLE. AND

963' FWL 819' FSL soavaronassa

Sec 13 T2S R4W USM
14. PzaxlT NO. 15. aLzvATroNa (Show whether or, NT, GE, sta.) 12. COUNTT 05 PARIBH 18. $TATE

43-013-31134 6 , 159 ' GR Duchesne Utah
1e· CheckApprepnote BoxTo Indicote Nature of Notice, Report,or Other Data

NOTICS OF INTENTION TO: BUBBBQUENT REPORT OF:

TzaT WATER BEUT•Orr PULL OR ALTER Cgs!NG WATER SHUT.Org REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLt:TE TRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CAalNG

SHOOT OR ACIDIzz ABANDON* SHOUTjNG Ott ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other) Drilling
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel

(Other) •ontpletion or Recompletion Report and Log inrm.)
1Î. DESCRIBE PROVOSED OR COMI'LETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths inr all markers and zones perti-
nent to this work.) *

December 6, 1985 through December 12, 1985
Drilled from 8 , 713 ' to 9, 858 ' in the Green River Formation

December 13, 1985 through December 19, 1985
Drilled from 9,858' to 10,435' in the Green River Formation
Ran a total of 258 joints of 7" 26# casing, cemented.

December 20, 1985 through December 26, 1985
Drilled from 10 , 435 ' to 11, 086 ' in the Wasatch Formation

December 27, 1985 through January 2, 1986
Drilled from 11,086' to 11,898' in the Wasatch Formation

January 3, 1986 through January 9, 1986
Drilled from 11, 898 ' to 12, 884 ' in the Wasatch Formation

BTIAL
Page 2

APP" VED BY TITLE I DATE
CWou.. US OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*SeeInstructionson Revers.



Form0GC-lb SL IN TitlPl.lt \ll
aTATE OF UTAH yr instrin tions on

reverse mir)
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING s. i.saas omaronarson suo suarat no.

Fee
6. Er INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR Talas NAMESUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)
1. Î. UNIT AGRESMENT NAME

OIL GAS
wsLL waLL OTaas

2. Naxa or OPERATOR 8. FAsu os r.sAas Maxa

Utex Oil Company
Lake Fork

3. ADDamag or GFaaAtoa 9. waLL No.

Suite 600, 1245 East Brickyard Road, Salt Lake City, Utah 84106 2-13B4
4. LochTroN or waLL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.• 10. riaLD AND rooL, on witocATSee also space 17 below.)

It surtse• A l tamont
11. sec., T., 8., M., 08 BLE. AND

BUSTST 05 AABA963' FWL 819' FSL
Sec. 13 T2S R4W USM

14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONa (Show whether or, RT, on, eta.} 12. conNTY os raarsa 18. arata
43-013-31134 6,159' GR Duchesne Utah

te· CheckAppropnote BoxTo Indicate Natureof Notice,Report,or OtherData
NOTICE OP I)fTENTION TO : BUS68QU3NT 557052 07 :

TzsT WATER BRUT•0FF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT.orp REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT Mtil.TIPLE COMPl.ETE FRACTURE TREATMENT AI.TERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIES ABANDON* SHooTING OR ACIDISINO ABANipONMENT*

REPAIR WELL ^^-

resulta of multiple completton on Wel(Other) roompletion Report and Log form.)
17. ossentas runn int di t dates, including estimated date of starting anyproposed wt pior , vertical depths for all maricers and nones perti-

nent to this
ACTIONNAME CODE(S) INTLNORM -

Drille TAMI l'/(,L mation
T.D. o
Ran a CLAUDIA ad.

STEPHANE --

RIG RE'

MILLIE FEB 20 1986

DIVISIONOF
Required Action Co OIL GAS & MININGl. Data Entry
2. Filming
3. Pa

rd Index CONRDENTIALb. File Label
c. Lists

4. Bonding Verification5. Other (See Norm)
18. I hereby cer

DATRISIGNED

(This space

APP"AVEr DATE

*SeeInstructionson Reverse



Form0GC-lb SL lN TitlN ill
4TATE OF UTAH er instrtwrious on

reverse wir)DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 6. LEASE DESIGNATION .kND SERIAL NO.

Fee

SUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTES OR TRIns NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)
1,

7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAMEOIL GAS
WELL WELL OTRER

2. NAME OP OPERATOR 8. FARM 08 LEASE NAMEUtex Oil Company
Lake Fork3. ADDSSES OF OPSEATOS 9. WELI. NO.

Suite 600, 1245 East Brickyard Road, Salt Lake City, Utah 84106 2-13B4
4. LOCATION OP WELL (Report location clearit and in accordance with any State requirements.• 10. PIBLD AND POOL, 08 WILDCATSee also space 17 below.)

'""I'**
A lt a mont

11. sac, T., s., x.. os ar.g. AND
963' FWL 819' FSL soavarosassa

Sec. 13 T2S R4W USM
14. PsamtT wo. 15. stavAttows (Show whether or, RT. on, etc.) 12. CooNTY os Paassa 18. stata43-013-31134 6,159' GR Duchesne Utah
te' CheckAppropriate BoxToindicateNatureof Notice,Report,or OtherData

Notica or INTaxTrox to: aussaquax: Åsrossor:

TEST WATER BROT•OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SRUT•OFF REPAIRINO WELL
FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

3HOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON• SHooTING OR ACIDizlNO ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CITANGE PLANs (Other) Drilling
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel(Other)
(hmpletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. osscalaE rnat>osto UMPLETED oPERATroNs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting anyproposed work. L eil is directionally drilled. sive subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-nent to this work.)

January 10 , 19 8 6 through January 16 , 19 8 6
Drilled from 12,884' to 13,000' in the Wasatch formation
T.D. of 13,000' on January 12, 1986
Ran a total of 99 joints of 5 " 18# casing, cemented.

RIG RELEASED AT 11:30 A.M. ON JANUARY 16, 1986

EB 20 1986

DIVISION OF
OIL GAS & MINING

CONRDENTIAL
Page 3

18. I hereby certity that the for ; is true and correct

SIGNED TITLE Secretary ago, Û.- - S
(This space to Federal or State omee use)

APP"OVED BT TITLE DATE
C suu. 8 OF APPROVAL, IF ANT:

*Seelustructionson Reverse



Forin )GC J ,

SLBMIT IN DEPL E* 56 64 01
STATE OF AH (See other instruc s

on reverse side)DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 6. LEASE DESIGNATION AND BERIAL N .

FEE
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OB TRIBE NAMEWELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETIONREPORTAND LOG *

. N/Ala. TYPE OF WELL:
DET Oder 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF COMPLETION: N/A
NEW WORK DEEP- PLEG DIFF.

S. FARM OB LEASE NAMEME LL OVER EN DACK RESVR. O Õther
2. NAME OF OPERATOn Lake Fork

UTEXOIL COMPANY * ""' NO.

3. ADDRESS OF OPEEATOR 2-1 384
1245 E. brickyard Rd., Ste. 600, Salt Lake gi )6 io. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

'OCATION or wELL (Report location clearly and in accordance saith an S tre&M gggggt
it .urrae. 963 ' FWL; 819 ' FSL 11. c.., a.. x.. OR BLOCK AND BURTEY

At top prod. interval reported below

at total a.pt DMSiO OF Sec. 13, T2S, R4W, USN
14. PERMIT NO 12. COUNTNT OR 13. BTATE

43-013-31134 10/9/85 Duchesne Utah
15. DATE SPCDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 17. DATE COMI L. (Ñ€GÅgto prod.) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, REB, ET, GE, ETC.). 1Û. ELET. CASINGHEAD

11/14/85 | 1/12/86 2/10/86 6,159' GR 6,159'
20. TorAL DEF¶R. MD A TVD 21. PLUO, BACK T.D., MD & TVD 22. IF MELTIPLE COMPL., 23. INTERVALS ROTART TOOLS CABLE TOOLS

HOW MANY• DRILLED BT
13,300' 13,292' | 0 - TD | N/A

24. PRODUCING INTERVAL($}, OF THIS COMPLETION-TOP, BOTTON, NAME (MD AND 25. WAS DIEECTIONAL
SURVET MADE

10,608' - 13,166' Wasatch No
26. TTPEDE CTRIC A OTHER GB RUN 27. WAS WELL COEED

28. CAFING RËCORD (Report all strings set i soeti)
CAstso sizE WEIGHT. La/rT.

,
DEPTH SET (M ) 1 HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECOED AMOUNT PULLED

9-5/8" 36# 5,000' 125" 1,633 sx ¯None
7" 26# 10,400' 8-3/4" l,UlU sx None

2fe LINER RECORD 30. TUBING RECORD
alzE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SAC CEMENT* SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPTE BET (MD) PACEEE BET (KD)

5" 0,200' IT3,294 450 2-7/8" lo,23b' 10,235'
3/8" 5,216' Heat StrinqŠl. PsaroaATroN xzcono (Intertial, an ona nunther) 52. ACÍD, $HOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE, li'I'C.

DEPTE INTERVAL (MD) AMOUNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL DBED

See Attached List. 10,608'-1$.,166' 18,000 gallons 15% HCL
13,500 gallons 2¾ KCL

3 spf; 510 holes

33.• PRODUCTION
DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD (FIOteifig, gag lif‡, pysmping--tiBS Ond i pg of puWLP) WELL STATus (Producing or

shut-in)
2/10/86 Flowing Producing

DATE OF TEST HOCas TESTED | CHOEE SlZE PROD'N. FOR OIL--BAL. GAs-MCF. WATEÀ--BBL. GAS-OIL RATIO
TEST PERIOD

3/1/86 72 35/64" 1,190 1 576 2,886 1.32:1
FLOW. TURING PREBS. CASING PRESECRE CALCELATED OtL-BBL. GAS-MCP. WATER-BBL. OIL GRATITT•API (CORE.)

I 24-H R RATE

200 | -0- --+ 396.70 525 962 41°
34. orsPostT2oN or Gaa (Bold, need for farel, vented, etc.) TraT wrTNrsano BT

Sold Don Baucum
35. LIST OF ATTACEMENTB

Perforation List /g¡
36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attaebed infor atton is complete and correct at determined trora all availabÏe redords /

SIGNED TITLE DATE

*(See lustructionsand Sooces for Additional Date on Reverse



INSTRUCTIONS

Generei: This form te dealgned far submitting a entoplete and correct o.211 conyletion venert and lag on all typea of lands and leases to either a Federal agency or a State agency.
-or both, pursuant te p¡ plienble Federal and/or Siate In.vs at:d regulut .na. Aa¿ escary upreita Instructions concerning the use of this form and the number of copies to be

subtnitted, partleularly with regard to local, area. er regloual procedures sud pic flees. etther cre aborn heb:w or will be issued by, or may be obtained from, the local Federal
and/or State enla See instructions on items 22 and 24, and 33. below regarding separate reoorta for separate completions.
If not filed prio: le the time this samœary Tonid is submitted, c<.pirs of all currently a utlaNs logr (d.illars, geologiste, sample and core analysis, all types electric, etc.), foruta-
tion and pressure 'esta, and actional sarveyA abould be attachel herete to the ax*ent required by applicable Federal and/or State laws and regulations. All attachments
should be listed on this form, see item 35.
Stem (: If there are no applicable State requirementa, locations on Federal or Indian land should be desettbed in accordance with Federal requirements. Consult local State
or Federal ofBee for specific instructions.
item 18: Indicate which elevation is used as reference (where not otherwise shown) for depth measurements given in other spaces on this form and in any attachments.
items 22 and 24. If this well W ce:npleted for separate production from more than de interval zone (multiple completion), so state in item 22, and in item 24 show the producing
interval, or Intervals, top(s), bottomis) and name(s) (if any) for only the interral reported in item 83. Submit a separate report (page) on this form, adequately identitled,
for ench additional Interval to be separately produced, showing the additional data pertinent to such interval.
Item 29: "Sacks Cement" Attached supplemental records for this well shouM show the details of any multiple stage cementing and the location of the cementing tool.
Item 33: Submit a separate completion report on thhtform for each interval to be separately produced. (See instruction for items 22 and 24 above.)

O

$7. BUMMARY OF POROUS EONES:
SHO½ AI.L IMPORTANT EONES OF POROBITT AND CONTENTS THERSOW CORED INTERTALB; AKD ALL DRILL-STEN TESTS, INCLUDING 88. OROLOGIC MARKERS
DEPTH INTaavAL TESTED, CUSBION USED, TIME TOOL OPEN, PLOw!NG AND BRUT-IN PRESSUmas, AMD BECOVERERS

FORMATION SOP BOTTOM DESCRIPTION, CONTENTS, BTC. TOP
MAMM

MMAR. D-PTR ThDE VERT.DEFTR

LOWERGREENRIVER 8,928' 10,606' Oil, gas & water

WASATCH 10,606' NR Oil, gas & water LOWERGREENRIV1R 8,928'

CARBONATE-MARKE: 0,492'

WASATCH 10,606'



LF/jsw

PERFORATIONS

LAKEFORK2-1384

Depths from DIFL dated 1/12/86

10,608-10 2 11,201-03 2 12,029-31 2
10,627-29 2 11,223-25 2 12,043-45 2
10,632-35 3 11,268-70 2 12,108-10 2
10,638-40 2 11,278-80 2 12,120-22 2
10,663-65 2 11,297-99 2 12,148-50 2
10,673-75 2 11,334-36 2 12,201-03 2
10,679-81 2 11,367-69 2 .

12,218-20 2
10,723-25 2 11,376-78 2 12,237-39 2
10,737-39 2 11,383-85 2 12,269-71 2
10,753-55 2 11,408-10 2 12,276-78 2
10,769-72 3 11,482-84 2 12,529-33 4
10,783-85 2 11,515-17 2 12,541-42 1
10,810-12 2 11,523-25 2 12,550-52 2
10,817-19 2 11,585-87 2 12,582-84 2
10,831-33 2 11,613-16 3 12,709-11 2
10,849-51 2 11,720-22 2 12,767-69 2
10,855-56 1 11,726-28 2 12,784-86 2
10,872-74 2 11,735-37 2 12,817-19 2
10,889-91 2 11,743-45 2 12,939-41 2
10,908-10 2 11,767-69 2 12,968-70 2
10,922-24 2 11,799-801 2 12,985-87 2
10,932-34 2 11,819-21 2 13,035-37 2
10,940-42 2 11,856-59 3 13,109-11 2
10,949-51 2 11,867-70 3 13,115-17 2
11,038-40 2 11,884-86 2 13,155-57 2
11,097-99 2 11,923-25 2 13,164-66 2
11,124-26 2 11,935-37 2
11,161-64 3 11,998-12,000 2

82 Zones
168'



ROUTING/ACTION FORM

SEQ NAME ACTION IN AL
NORM
TAMI

, jVICKY /CLAUDIA (sfËPHANE /
CHARLES
RULA gy
MARY ALICE {
CONNIE
MILLIE
RON
JOHN
GIL

PAM

NOTES: ACTION CODE
1. DATA ENTER
2. FILM
3. POST

a. CARD FILE
b. FILE LABEL
c. LISTS

4. FILE
5. RELOCATE FILE OR CARD
6. DECISION
7. PREPARE LETTER

12. OTHER - SEE



oT.N.9,3 TED STATES senwir I tea- a e so eau so. o4
orméerly 9- DEPART - T OF THE INTERIOR re°r'A"A

SUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS
(De not ase this form for proposals to drill or te deepta or plag back to a (tgerest reogryg

Use "APPt.ICATION FOR PERMIT-." for sech propeents.)

As q '.'LL O ..... CA-96-00060
2. naus or ormazzos 8. Pasm om LaaSB RAma

pymynTT COMPANY
3. soomass or orsaatoa 0. wsz.r. so.

p n BOX 2967 HOUSTON TEXAS, 77252-2967 Lake Fork 2-13B4
4. Location or m at.t. (Report location clearly and la accordance with any State requirements.• 10. FIELD AND POOL, 08 WILDCATSee also space 17 below.)

at ••rf•••
- Altamont

11. asc., T, t., M., on ALE. ANDT2S-R44 Section 13 .ona on an.«

T2S-R4W
14. Psa IT No. 16. ELEVATIONS (Show whether or. sT, om, etr.) 12. COUNTT 05 rastaa 13. trats

t.. 3 . Og . Duchesne UT
se· Geck Appropnote BoxToadicateNature of Notice,Report,or OtherData

NOTIC3 OF INTENTION TO: 8083EQURNT REPORT 07:

TEST WATER 38014FT PCLL 08 ALTla C.431NG WATER 880T•OFF REFA3RIW6 W3LL
PRACTURE TREAT 38ULTIPLE CONFr.ETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CAgrNe
SNOOT 08 ACIDizS ABANDON* BROOTING OR ACIDiziMO ABANDONNENT*
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Ôther) CHANGE OP OPERATOR

(NoTs: Report results of muittple completion on Wel(Other) Complettom or Recorapletion Report and Ug form.)
17. omscalsE l'BOPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONs (Clearly state alt pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including eettmated date of starting anyprooesed work. If weil is dirwetionally drilled, give subsur<ace locatiums and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and sones peru-nens to this work.) *

DUE TO UTEX OIL COMPANY BANKRUPTCY AND THEIR SUBSEQUENT REJECTION
OF THE OPERATING AGREEMENT.GOVERNING OPERATIONS FOR THIS WELL,
PENNZOIL COMPANY BY MAJORITY VOTE OF THE NON OPERATORS IN THIS
WELL HAS SUCCEEDED UTEX AS OPERATOR EFFECTIVÈDECEMBER 12 1986.

MAR25 1837

DMSION OF
AS & ENING

IS. I hereby critify f egoing is ad correct

SIGNED '
.. ITLE DATE'

P PH WTTTT Mg SUPERVTSING ENG.I.NEW MAR - i , I 4H /(This space for Federal of State omce ase)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS or APPROVAL, 17 ANT:

*SeeInstructionson ReverseSide

Title 15 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knoscangly and willfully to make to any department or agency of



PENNZOIL COMPANY RE
PENNZOIL PLACE • P. O. BOX 2967 • HOUSTON, TEXAS77252-2967 • (713) 546-4000

AUG 4 1987
DIVISIONOF OIL
GAS &MINING

July 30, 1987

Utah Natural Resources
Division of Oil, Gas, & Mining
Attn: Tammy Searing
355 Triad Center, Suite #350
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

Ms. Searing:

This letter is to confirm our telephone conversation of July 30, 1987,
regarding the name change from Pennzoil Exploration & Production Co. to
Pennzoil Company.

Please change your records to reflect this name change effective August
1, 1987.

Your contact for drilling operations will continue to be Will Luna at
our Neola office. The contact for the monthly production reports will
be myself at our Houston address. All affected properties, except the
drilling activity, are listed on the attached production report for
June, 1987. The bonding is in the name of Pennzoil Company.

This is a change in name only, the company and personnel have remained
. the same., If you need additional information, please call me at

(713)-046-8104.

Si ,

Martin Wilson
Onshore Accounting



00GM 56-64-1
; an equal opportunity employ

UTAH '
NATURALRESOURCE:
00, Gas & Mining

355 West North Temple, 3 Triad Center, Suite 350, Salt Lake City, Ut j2 )2
84180-1203.O(801-538-5340) Page- Of -

MONTHLY OIL AND GAS PRODUCTION REPORT

Operator name and address:

M & NDU U Utah Account No. N2885

P 0 BOX 2967,25TH FL.
HOUSTON TX 77252 2967 Report Period (Month/Year) Ú ÛÏ
ATTN: M.LLAURN--L-tfNA

Amended Report

Wel Name Producing Days Production Volume

API Number Entity Location Zone Oper Oil (BBL) Gas (MSCF) Water (BBL)

0.L GALLOWAY 1-1482
A3o330564 05965 025 02W 14 WSTc 26 913 /55A //PC
STATE P1CKUP 1-681E

304730169 05970 025 01E 6 GRRV
OBlL-LAMI. UR 1-8A2

301330036 05975 ois o2w 8 wsTC
RACHEL JENSEN 2-16c5
4301330912 09895 035 oSW 16 WSTC
LAKE FORK #2-1384 -
4301331Ï3410452 ä'à 030 13 WsTC (9 |1
HAICH 2 381
3oiÛi 47 10615 025 olW 3 wsTc 1 5 /¤47 Gro
ORL2RG 2-981
joliii 51 10616 02S 01W 9 WSTC ge /g jg

SRAW #2 27A2
4301331184 10753 bis ó2W 27 wsTC JO | GAS Afof

TOTAL ÛÛ

Comments (attach separate sheet if necessary)

I have reviewed this report and certify the information to be accurate and corr plete. Date

N, Telephone AÔ
Authorized signaiure

PLEASE COMPLETE FORMS IN BLACK



Page 3 of 4

SUNDRYNOTICE OF NA ANGE
EXHIBIT A

ENTITY LEASE NAME LEGAL API REMARKS
RUMBER DESC.

5780 VIC BRONN 1-4A2 1S 2N 4 4301330011
5785 UTE ALOTTED 1-36Z2 1N 2N 36 4301330307
5790 HORROCKS 1-6Al 1S 1N 6 4301330390 2;
5795 J YACK 1-7A1 1S IN 7 4301330018
5800 BASTAIN FEE #1 1S 1N 7 4301330026
5805 CHASEL FLY DIAMOND 1-18A1 1S 1N 18 4301330030
5810 STATE 3-18Al 1S 1N 18 4301330369
5815 RG DYE 1-29A1 1S 1N 29 4301330271 g)S3Í
5820 SUMMERALL1-30 Al 1S 1N 30 4301330250
5825 LL PACK 1-33A1 1S 1N 33 4301330261
5835 UTE 11-6A2 1S 2N 6 4301330381
5836 UTE 2-7A2 1S 2H 7 4301331009
5840 DOUG BRONN 1-4A2 1S 2N 4 4301330017
5845 LAMICQ URRUTY4-5A2 1S 2N 5 4301330347
5850 UTE 1-7A2 1S 2N 7 4301330025
5855 LAMICQ URRUTY 2-9A2 1S 2N 9 4301330046 SRAŸ
5860 STATE 1-10A2 1S 2N 10 4301330006
5865 SPRGFIELD M/BK 1-10A2 1S 2N 10 4301330012
5870 L. BOREN 2-11A2 1S 2N 11 4301330277
5875 KENDALL 1-12A2 1S 2N 12 4301330013
5876 CLYDE MURRAY1-2A2 1S 2N 2 4301330005ÛRA.\Î
5877 BLANCHARD 1-3A2 1S 2N 3 4301320316 (0
5880 OLSEN 1-12A2 1S 2N 12 4301330031
5885 L.BOREN 1-14A2 1S 2N 14 4301330035 Ag
5890 UTE 3-18A2 1S 2N :03 4301330125
5895 UTE TRIBAL 4-19A2 1S 2N 19 4301330147
5900 L. BOREN 5-22A2 1S 2N 22 4301330107
5905 L. BOREN 4-23A2 1S 2N 23 4301330115 ,7'

5910 UTE TRIBAL 5-30A2 1S 2N 30 4501530169 99f

5920 BECKSTEAD 1-30A3 IS 3N 30 4301330070 Erd 0/*

5925 UTE TRIBAL 10-13A4 1S 4N 13 4301330301
5930 KARL SHISLER 1-381 2S 1N 3 4301330249
5935 CB HATCH 1-5B1 2S 1N 5 4301330226
5940 NORLING 1-981 2S 1N 9 4301330315
5945 H.G. COLTHARP 1-15B1 2S 1N 15 4301330359
5950 GEORGE MURRAY1-16B1 2S 1N 16 4301330297
5960 EH BUZZI 1-1182 2S 2N 11 4301330248 STÛ-
5965 DL GALLONAY1-14B2 2S 2N 14 4301330564
5970 STATE PICKUP 1-6BlE 2S 1E G 4ß04730169 )S'fdi
5975 LAMICQURRUTY 1-8A2 1S 2N 8 4301330036
9770 SMITH 1-14C5 3S EN 14 4301330980
9895 RACHEL JENSEN 2-16C5 3S 5N 16 4301330912
10452 LAKEFORK2-13B4 2S 4N 13 4301331134
10615 HATCH 2-381 2S 1N 3 4301331147
10616 NORLING 2-9B1 2S 1N 9 4301331151
10679 ROBERTSON 2-29A2 1S 2N 29 4301331150
10753 SHAW 2-27A2 1S 2N 27 4301331184
10764 LAMICQ URRUTY4-17A2 1S 2N 17 4301331190 9 •

.

10785 BOREN 3-11A2 ~

.05 2N 11 4301331192
N10794 LAMICQ2-20A2 1S 2N 20 4301331191 11 a il 3,0/3-3/903

AFRESTON 2-8B1 2S 1N 8 43013$1203 CURRENTLYBEING DRILLED et i

ALEKALUD MAan A-1/LD >WU > bW 11 4>Ulsv4998 SALI WAlhR DISPOSAL NELL Upogy,ggggg-C¿¾ii
\ANDERSON 2-28A2 SND 1S 2N 28 4E04399992 SALT NATER DISPOSAL NELL 9-013-3o3 AN



DB/Æ+Form 5
May 5, 1987

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 6. LBABB DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

ONOF
C11.. (A 6. IT INDIAN, ALLOTTER Og talas NAME

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON. WELLŠ
(De not nae this form for pro sals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.

Use "APP CATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

i. 7. UNIT Anassaan? Naus

OW
LI.

WAS
r. O 42...

2. NAxx or orsaatos 8. rann om Laasa xaxa
Pennzoil Company Utah Acct. # NO705 See Attached List

3. ADDamas 07 OPERATOR 9. wsLL NO.

P.O. Box 2967 Houston, TX 77252-2967
4. LOCATION Or wmLL (Report location blearly and in accordance with any State requirementa.* 10. riaLD Axo roor., 08 WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
At surface Rlneholl /Altamont

See Attached List of Wells 11..se..=.....x.oast=.ann
BURVET 05 ABBA

14.AP I NUMBER 15. 3LEVATroNs (Show whether or, aT, an. sta.) 12. COUNTY Os FAzzaal 18. sTAza

Duchesne & Utah
Uintah

ze· CheckAppropnate BoxTo IndicateNatureof Notice, Report,or OtherData
NOTIC3 07 INTENTION TO: 80BasqURNT maroxT 09:

TEST WATER SECT•OFT FULL OR ALTER .CAslNG WATER BRUT-0FF REPAIRING WELE.

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPt.ETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CAstNG

BHOOT OR ACIDiz8 ABANDON* 3BOOTING OR ACIDiz!NG ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELI. CHANGE PLANs (Other)
Notz : Report resulta of multiple completion on Wel

<other> Operator Name Change _L l'umpletionor Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DEscalas rnovosan na cuMPLETED OPERATIONS (Cleurly state att pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti•
nent to this work.) *

Change of operator name from Pennzoil Company to Pennzoil Exploration &
Production Company, effective June 1, 1988.

See Attached List of wells OILANDGAS
DRN RJF

JRS GLH

DTS SLS

- MICROFILM

.y
-FILE

18. I hpreby cor that the f g is e and correct

BIGNED ½A U
TITEWestern Div. Production Mqr-orra 4 £8

. ( is sp for Federal or State omce tase)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, 1F ANY:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse



UNITED STATES •¿gro,rn var r s· ‡•,*,',"¿••;"°°,4,-0135

DEPARTM T OF THE INTERIOR ..r-.se. I a.. .....49.2.......BRIAL 80

' BUREAU vr LANDMANAGEMENT

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not see tats form for proposals to drill or to deepra er plus beek to a digervat reserrott.

Use ••APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for each proposals.)

LL ELL O .....

2. NAME Or OPasaTom
8. PAAN 04 LBABB NAME

Pennzoil Exploration and Production C Lakefork

3. Apoassa or orsaatos
9. WELL 80.

P.O. Box 2967, Houston, TX 77252 2-13B4

4. LOCATioN Or n EI.L (Report location clearly sad in accordance ith iny i QË kmu# 10. rista ano roOL, 08 WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
At eurface DMS ugep it. ..c..... B., M. OB BLE. ¾

GILGAS&MÐlN
Sec. 13, T2S, R4W

14 raanry No. to. EsarArton (Show whether oi, sT oi etc.) 12. Coasty os rasism 18. BTars

6159' GL 6183' KB Duchesne UT

CheckAppropnoteBoxTo Indicate Nature of Notice,R st, or OtherData

notics or intaxTzos 10:
sessaquant marcar or:

TEST WATSB 880T4WF PCLL OR ALTER CASING WATSB SBUT4PF REPAIRING WELL

PRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPI.ETE raACTras TEBATMENT ALTsažNC CASING

BROOT 08 AffDIEE
ASANDON* S-OOTING GB ACIDiz!Wo ABANDONuspT*

REPatR WELL CNANCE Pl.ANS (Ôther)
(NoTE: Report reenits of moittple completion oa Wel

(Otber)
Completion or Recoupletion Report and Log form.)

17. os.sentar I•aordSED OR CONIPLETED OPERATroNr (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, toeloding estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If well is directionalty drillet, give subsastace locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and sones perti-

ment to this work.) •

Propose to acidize 10,411-13,166' with 15,000 gallons 7-1/2% HCL.

18. I hereby cert e re ang is e ad correct

arcuzo ritLE
Supervising Engineer 3

(This space for ederal or State oSce see) APPROVED BY I h S
APPROVED BY TITLE F H D! 18! iPO
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL. IF ANT: AS, AND NING

ATP 704' a
*Seeinskuetionson ••se

Tatte 16 U.S.C Sectron 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the

-- e--.-- -.. < . Manus or fraudulent statements or representettons as to any matter within its



Fgrm0GC-Ib SUBM TitlNL\fi

E OF UTAH tot struenon- on

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES -

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING , g,gggg pggiongt!ON WO ggsm, NO.

" 8. tr INDIAN, ALLOTTSB Og talas NAMS

SUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS
(De not noe this form for pronossia to drill or to deepea or plus back to a diferens reservoir

Use "APPflCATION FOR rzRhtlT- ter such presosais.y

1. . uurt seassusut saals
waLLL

wsLL O .....

Pennzoil Exploration and Production Company
. soonssa or orsaatos

P.O. Box 2967, Houston, TX 77252 2-13B4

4. LOCATION OF WELL ( eport oca a e ear y an a accor see a täte rttuireme
See also space 17 below.)
At surtaee Altamont/Wasatch

1. sac. T., a.. M., on es.s. Ann
soavar os assa

Sec 13, T2J4, RAW

14. PsattlT Wo. 16. aLaTATrons (abowwhether o 12. county os vastaa 18. et s

API 43-013-31134-00 6159' (GL) 6183' ---- Duchesne UT

teck AppropneteBoxTo Indicate Natureof Notice,Report,or Ôther ato

NOTICE OP INTENT30N to: BUssaqusNT BSPORT OF:

TEST WATER GEOT4FF PUI.L 08 ALTER CasiNO wATan SNUT Opp aarAlalNG WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE ¢OMPLETE FRACTURE TBBATMENT ALTERING CASING

SMOoT na ACIDIZE ABANDON* BROUTING OR ACIDI3tNO
ABANDOWMENT*

REFAIR WELL cttANGE PLAxa (Other)
(Nots: Report results of multiple completion on Wel

(Other) ('ompletion or Recomµletion Report and Log form.)

17. DEstates ruuPOSED AR COMPLETED OPERATIONs (Clearly state all pertinent detalla, and give pertinent dates. Including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. It well is directionally drilled. give subsurface loestions and measured and true vertical deptha for all atarkers and annes perti-

nont to this work.) *

Acidized Wasatch perfs 10411-13166' with 15000 gallons 7-1/2% HCL.

B. Ì hereby eer Jtoregoing e and correct

.rnwan . A tots Supervising Engineer pay, -G-g§

ThiÃspace for Federsi or State osce use)

AP""^VED BT TITLE DATE

co:.un. 5 07 APPROVAL. 17 ANT:

*SeeInstructionson Revers.



O=crm a - ST F UTAH
OEPAATMENT 0 ATURAMRESOURCES

6. t.aase D•••9nanon ano senasNumoerDIVISION OF OIL, GAS ANDMINING t Fee
. Indian ANOt[Ge or Tribn Namn

N/ASUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLSCa not use mis form for proposals to drilinew weds;deeoen extstintywetistor to reentar:pfuggeckand abandoned wetts, 8. Unit or Gommuntttzation AgreementUse APPfdCATIORFOR PERMIT----forsuch procosais:.
. .. . N/ A

.pe onvo
a. won Name ana NumoerE. ° O wa.I O otnertspac:M

Lake Fork #2-13B4.
Name atoperator

to. API Wen NumnerANR Production Company 43-013-31134
orceerator -

-

4. Telegnone Numoer u.Field ana Poet, or WudentP.O. Box 749 Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Altamont5.l.acanon at well
=cotage : 963' FWL & 819' FSL county : Duchesneco, see. T.. R.. M. : SW/ SW Section 13, T2S, RAW

State : UTAH
CHECKAPPÄÒPRIATEBOXES TO INDICATENATUREOENOTlCEi.REPÖÈÌ,OR dIHEROATANOTICE OF INTENT

SUBSEQUENT REPOAT(Submrt in Duplicatep
.

(Submit Origmal Form Only)Abanconment New Construc::on i
Abanaanment • New ConstrucconCasing Repair OP il or ^iter casmo O casingsepair OFn °r^tter casingChange of Plans O accomtetton O enansaor era = 0 3 =or ^cietz.Conversion to injection Q Shoot or AMze O Conversion to infection Q Vent or RareFracture Treat O venter mar• O Fract r•Trem O watersaut-onMultipte Completion Q Water Shut-QU g Omer rMpos of onera torOttler

Date of WoricCompletionApproximate Date Woric WHiStart
Aepart results of Mutante comotadensand Recemotenens to ditterern resessoirsorsWELLCOMPLET10N OR RECOMPLETIONAND LOG form.
* Must be accomoanied by a cementverideadan teoort.1DESCRISE PAOPOSED CA COMPLETEDOPERATIONS (Ctearty state au peninent decails, and give pertinent dates, it wellis direedottatty drifted, give subauttaae

locanonsand measured and true vertical depots for all maritersand zones pertinent to artswarx.)

Effective 12/1/92 ANR Production Company took overoperations on the above-referenced well from PennzoilExploration & Production Company.

DECO7 1992

DMS10NOF
OILGAS&MININE

s use only)

GUP
See insonadens on Reverse



Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(June 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR "g'p'ireMa e 31 9 3

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Base Designation and Serial No.

Fee
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICA TE
7. It unit or cA, Agreement oesignation

1. Type of Well C.A. 9660

11
Gae

I Oder 8. Well Name and No.

2. Nameof Operator Lakefork 2-13B4
Pennzoil Exploration and Production Company 9.APIWellNo.

3. Address and Telephone No 43-013-31134
P.O. Box 290; Neola , Utah 84053 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description> Al tamont - Wasatch
11. County or Parish. State

SWSWSec. 13, T2S, R4W Duchesne, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Aoandonment Change of Plans

Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Repon Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

O Final Abandonment Notice Aheng Cuing Convmion to Injecdon

o e, Resign Operatorship O oisposewater
(Note: Reportresultsof multiplecompletionon Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form]

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent detaiis, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Pennzoil resigned operatorship of the subject well as of December 1, 1992.

The property is now operated by ANR Production Co., Altamont, Utah.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct

Signed Title PetPOleum Engineer oate ?
(This space for Federal or State office use)

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false fictitious or fraudulent statements
or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See instruction on Reverse



)P 0
GEas d MS

T
°"

ttach all documentation received by the division regarding this change. 2¾>

nitial each listed item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable. 3-VLC
4]LJF |

XChange of Operator (well sold) O Designation of Agent Sltief v'
J Des.ignation of Operator O Operator Name Change Only 6-ADA r

he operator of the we11(s) listed below has changed (EFFECTIVE DATE: 12-01-92 )

EO (new operator) ANR PRODUCTION COMPANY FROM(former Operator) PENNZOIL EXPLOR & PROD CO.

. (address) Po Box 749 · (addreSS) PO BOX 2967 25TH FL
DENVER CO 80201-0749 HOUSTON TX 77252-2967

PAULA BLISS GREG DAVIS

phone (303 )572-1121 phone (713 )546-6195

account no. N0675 account no. N2885

le11(s) (attach additional page if needed): *CA 96-000060/UTU58769

Name GFdC2 13B4]G1t-WS API: 43-013-31134 Entity: 10452 Sec_1_3Twp28 Rng_4W Lease Type: FEE

Name: API: Entity: Sec__ Twp Rng___ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec___Twp_ Rng___ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec__ Twp Rng_ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec___Twp Rng_ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec___Twp._ Rng__ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec___Twp___Rng. Lease Type:

JPERATOR CHANGEDOCUMENTATION

1. (Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or other lecal documentation has been received from former
operator (Attach to thi s form) · 74 -

/2-¡E-îa he/Á/2-.2/-fÑ
2. (Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or other legal documentation has been rece'i'ved from newoperator

(Attach to this form).(had/ /2-2-fÃ)

3. The Department of Commerce has been contacted if the new operator above is not currently
operating any wells in Utah. Is company registered with the state? (yes/no) If
yes, show company file nùmber: .

4. (For Indian and Federal Hells ONLY) The BLM has been contacted regarding this change
(attach Telephone Documentation Form to this report). Make note of BLM status in
comments section of this form. Management review of Federal and Indian well operator
changes should take place prior to completion of steps 5 through 9 below.

5. Changes have been entered in the Oil and Gas Information System (Wang/IBM) for each well
listed above. (¡p,7gsy;

6. Cardex file has been updated for each well listed above. (ip->f-fú?

7. Well file labels have been updated for each well listed above. (/>-7246)

8. Changes have been included on the monthly "Operator, Address, and Account Changes" memo
for distribution to State Lands and the Tax Commission.(n ardú7

9. A folder has been set up for the Operator Change file, and a copy of this page has been
placed there for reference during routing and processing of the original documents.

- OVER



iRATOR CHANGENORKSHEET(CONfINUED) Init each item when completed. Nrite N/A tem is not applicable.

TITY REVIEH

dil. (Rule R615-8-7) Entity ass y ments have been reviewed for all wells listed above. Here
entity changes made? (yes/no (If entity assignments were changed, attach c_opies of -

Form 6, Entity Action Form).

L 2. State Lands and the Tax Commission have been notified through normal procedures of
entity changes.

ND VERIFICATION (Fee wells only)

1. (Rule R615-3-1) The new operator of any fee lease well listed above has furnished a
proper bond . /¿ác6322/(¿ggg "//4J,/ hejác Í2smang "

2. A copy of this form has been placed in the new and former operators' bond files.

3. The former operator has requested a release of liability from their bond (yes/no .

Today's date Ûze-9ß) 19Ý>-
. If yes, division response was made by letter

dated 19__ .

ASE INTEREST OHNER NOTIFICATION RESPONSIBILITY

1. (Rule R615-2-10) The former operator/lessee o,f.any fee lease well listed above has been
notified by letter dated (-- 9' 19_

_,
of their responsibility to notify any

person with an interest in such lease of the change of operator. Documentation of such
notification has been requested.

2. Copies of documents have been sent to State Lands for changes involving State leases.

LMING
1

All attachments to this form have been microfilmed. Date: =- aca / 19fat .

LING

'1. Lopies of all attachments to this form have been filed in each well file.

2. The ori.g_i_n_al of this form and the _origin_a..] attachments have been filed in the Operator
Change file.

MMENTS



Pt Stat f Utah *
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

Norman H. Bangerter
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

Governor
Dee C. Hanseri

355 West North Temple

Executive Director 3 Triad Center. Suite 350

Dianne R. Nielson, Ph.D. Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

Division Director 801-538-5340

January 4, 1993

Mr. D. R. Lankford
Pennzoil Exploration & Production Company
P.O. Box 290
Neola, Utah 84053

Dear Mr. Lankford:

Re: Notification of Sale or Transfer of Fee Lease Interest - Lakefork 2-1384 Well, Section 13,
Township 2S, Ranqe 4W, Duchesne County, Utah, API No. 43-013-31134

The division has received notification of a change of operator from Pennzoi! Exploration and
Production Company to ANR Production Company for the referencedwell which is located on
a fee lease.

Rule R649-2-10 of the Utah Oiland Gas Conservation General Rules, requiresthat the owner of
a lease provide notification to any person with an interest in such lease (working interest or
royalty interest), when all or part of that interest in the lease is sold or transferred.

This letter is written to advise Pennzoil Exploration and Production Company of its responsibility
to notify all individuals with an interest in this lease of the change of operator. Please provide
written documentation of this notificationto the division no later than January 25, 1993.

- Sincerely,

Don Staley
Administrative Manager
Oiland Gas

Idc
cc: R.J. Firth
WOl201

an equal opportunity



PENNZOIL EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY
PENNZOIL PLACE • P.O. BOX 2967 • HOUSTON, TEXAS 77252-2967 • (713) 546-4000

February 2, 1993

State Of Utah
Department of Natural Resources
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
355 West North Temple
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

Attn: Don Staley
AdministrativeManager
Oil & Gas

Re: Change of Operator
Lakefork2-13B4 Well •#3-O /3- J/ / J
Section 13, T2S-R4W
Duchesne County, Utah

Dear Mr. Staley:

In response to your letter dated January 4, 1993, please be advised that there was not a transfer or
sale of interest associated with the transfer of operatorship of the referenced well from Pennzoil
Exploration and Production Company to ANR Production Company. Pennzoil still owns the
same working interest in the well as it did prior to ANR taking over as operator.

Should you have any questions concerning this matter, please feel free to give me a call at (713)
546-6195.

Senior Landman FEoO4 1993

DMSiCN07

a subsidiary of PENNZOIL



FonM e E OF UTAH

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING
5. Lease Designation and Serial Number:

Fee

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS MintAan.NaarTdbeNarne:

N/A
7. UnitAgreement Name'

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells.
Use APPUCAT10NFOR PERMITTO DRILLOR DEEPEN form for a proposals N/A

1. Type of Well: OIL GAS OTHER:
8. Well Name and Number:

Lake Fork #2-13B4

2. Name of Operator 9. API Weil Number

ANR Production Company 43-013-31134

3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat

P, O, Box 749 Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Altamont

4. Location of Well

Foolages: 963' FWL & 819' FSL county: Duchesne

QQ, Soc..T.,A.,M.: SW/SW Section 13, T2S-R4W state: Utah

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE N ATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEGUENTREPORT
(Subenit in Dupnaste) (Submit Original Form Only)

O Abandonment O New Construction O Abandonment O New Construction

O casingRepair O Pull or After Casing O Casing Repair O Pull or Alter Casing

O Change of Plans O Recompletion O Change of Plans O Shoot or Acidize

O conversionto injection O Shoot or Acidize O conversionto injection O Vent or Flare

O Fracture Treat 0 ventor Flare O Fracture Treat O watershut-off

O Multiple Completion 0 Water Shut-Off Other Install Rod Pumo

O other
Date of work completion 6/10/93

Approximate date work willstart Report results of Multiple Compostions and Recompletione to different teoefvoirs on WELL
COMPLEilON OA RECOMPLET10N AND LOG form.

* Mustbe accompanied by a cement verificationreport.

12. DESCRIBE PAOPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERAT10NS(Clearly state all pertinent details, and give perdnent dates. It well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true

verticaldepths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Please see the attached chronological history for the installation of a rod pump on

the above referenced well.

DMSIONOF

Name&Signature: Title: Regulatory Analyst oat.: 6/18/93
leen Danni Dey

(This apeos for Stato see only)

(12\92) (See Instrucdons on Aaverse



THECOASTALCORPORATION
PRODUCTIONREPORT

CHRONOLOGICALHISTORY

LAKEFORK#2-1384 (INSTALLRODPUMP, RETIRESUBMERSIBLEPUMP) PAGE1
SECTION 13, T2S-R4W
ALTAMONTFIELD
DUCHESNECOUNTY,UTAH
WI: 39.22656% ANR AFE: 64588, 64589
TO: 13,300' PBTD: 13,292'
5" LINER@ 10,200'-13,294'
PERFS: 10,608'-13,166' (WASATCH)
CWC(M$):136.1

4/13/93 LD 2-7/8" DSS-HT. RU, NDWH, NUhydril. Unplug cable. LD hanger.
RU spoolers. POOH& LD 212 jts 2-7/8" DSS-HT tbg. SDFN.
DC: $4,509 TC: $4,509

4/14/93 Cont POOH& LO 95 jts 2-7/8" tbg (307 jts total of DSS-HT) and
submersible BHA. Sent 2-7/8" DSS-HT tbg to PRS to re-cut threads.
NDhydril, NUblind flange. RD rig.
DC: $2,947 TC: $7,456

6/7/93 RIH w/prod BHA. Spot & RU rig. ND blind flange, NU6" 5M BOP. PU
7" 26# cup-type RBP & retr hd, set RBP @ 3020'. Attempt to set @
2954', would not set. Set RBP@3020' w/95 jts in hole. Strip off
BOP& dual hanger csg head. Strip on single hanger csg head & BOP.
Test void to 3500#, held. Rls RBP from 3020'. POOH.
DC: $2,551 TC: $10,007

6/8/93 Prep to run rods. PU prod BHA. RIH w/7 jts 2-7/8" FS-150 & 7" 26#
B-2 TAC. RIH w/88 jts out of derrick. PU & RIH w/227 jts FS-150
tbg. Drifted all tbg. Set 7" 26# TAC @ 9896' in 16,000# tension.
PSN @ 10,124' & E0T @ 10,163'. Land hanger. NDBOP, NU prod "T" &
flowline.
DC: $8,230 TC: $18,237

6/9/93 Cont PU rods. PU new 2-1/2" x 1-3/4" x 26' RHBCpump. Run broach
thru tight spot 9 S'. Pump still hung up @5'. NDprod "T". Rls 7"
26# TAC from 9896'. CO top jt of 2-7/8" FS-150 tbg. Had small crimp
in jt. Set TAC @ 9896' in 16,000# tension. Land tbg. NU prod "T".
PU & RIH w/1-3/4" pump, 7 - 1" w/double plus, 128 - 3/4" slick, 6 -

3/4" w/double plus, 3 - 7/8" w/new Huber guide, 130 - 7/8" slick and
15 - 1" rods.
DC: $21,601 TC: $39,838

6/10/93 Final - well producing. Cont PU 1" rods. Have 127 - 1" rods in
well. Seat pump. PT to 500#, held. Good pump action. RD rig.
Turn over to production @ 1:30 p.m. Drop from report.
DC: $19,104 TC:



FM i STATE OF UTAH

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
5. Lease Designadon and Sedal Number:

Fee

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS * '""°

N/A
Do not use this fonn for proposals to ddli new wells, deepen exisdng wells, or to leenter plugged and abandoned weila 7. UnitAgreement Name:

Use APPUCATION FOR PERMiT TO DRILLOR DEEPEN form for such proposals N/A
1. Type of Well: OIL GAs O OTHER: 8. Well Name and Number:

Lake Fork #2-13B4
2. Name rator.

9. API WO
3- 13 4

3. Address and Telephone Numben
(3 0 3 ) 5 73 - 4 4 54 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

P. O. Box 749 Denver, CO 80201-0749 Altamont
4. Location of Well

Footages: 963' FWL & 819' FSL county: Duchesne
oo.sec.,T..n.,M.: SW/SW Section 13, T2S-R4W

state: Utah

11· CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICEOF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT .

(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

O Abandonment O New Construction O Abandonment O New Construction
g Casing Aepair O Pull or After Casing O Casing Repair O Pull or Alter Casing
O Change of Plans O Recompletion O Change of Plans O Shoot or Acidize
O conversionto injection O Shoot or Acidize O Conversion to injection O Vent or Flare
O Fracture Treat O Vent or Flare O Fracture Treat O Water Shut-Off
O MultipleCompletion O Water Shut-Off O Other

Other Cleanout Wellbore and Run Sidestring &

Production Log Date of work completion
Approximate date work willstart 10/15/93 Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirson WELL

coMPLET10N OR RECOMPLET10N AND LOG form.
* Must be accompanied by a cement verificationreport.

12. DESCRIBEPADPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATlONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, if well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and truevertical depths for all markers and zones pettinent to this work.)

Please see the attached procedure to repair the 7" casing, cleanout the wellbore and
run a sidestring and production log in the well.

Name&Signatum: y¡g Production Superintenden . 9/16/93Ma c D. Ernest

(This speos for State use only)

(imo2) (seeinstructions on neverse



WORKOVER PROCEDUÑ
(Repair Casing Leak)

LAKE FORK #2-13B4
SECTION 13-T2S-R4W

ALTAMONTFIELD
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

LOCATION: 963' FWL& 819' FSL

ELEVATION: 6,159' GR 6,159' KB

TOTALDEPTH: 13,300' PBTD: 13,292'

CASING: 9Va", 36#, J-55 ST&C@5,000'; cmt'd w/1633 sx
7", 26#, P110 & N-80 LT&C@ 10,400'; cmt'd w/1010 sx
5", 18#, P110 FL-4S from 10,200'-13,294'; cmt'd w/450 sx

TUBULARDATA
Capacity Burst Collapse

Description ID Drift (B/F) (osi) (psi)
9Va" 36# 0-55 8.921" 8.765" .0773 3520 2020
7" 26# P-110 6.276" 6.151" .0382 9960 62107" 26# N-80 6.276" 6.151" .0382 7240 5410
5" 18# P-110 4.276" 4.151" .0177 13940 13450

WW¾isfŒl
Feb. 1986 Initial Completion. Perf 10,608'-13,166', 3 SPF, 510 holes.

Acdz w/18,000 gals 15% HC1.
Flowed: 396 BOPD, 962 BWPD,525 MCFPD, FTP 200 psi, 35/64" chk

May 1989 Acdz Wasatch perfs from 10,608'-13,166' w/15,000 gals 15% HC1.
Prior Production: 15 B0PD, 20 MCFPD, 0 BWPD- Flowing
Post Production: 454 80PD, 1400 MCFPD,488 BWPD- Flowing

Aug. 1989 Install Submersible Pump
Prior Production: 59 B0PD, 118 MCFPD, 82 BWPD- Flowing
Post Production: 124 80PD, 426 MCFPD,515 BWPD

June 1993 Replace Submersible Pump w/Beam Pump
Prior Production: 32 B0PD, 195 MCFPD, 524 BWPD
Post Production: 35 80PD, 82 MCFPD,400 BWPD

WitidWifitü$
Shut-in, WOworkover. Last production July 17, 1993: 25 BO, 581 BW, 65



WORKOVER PROC RE - LAKE FORK #2-1384 Page #2

Imam
1) MIRU. POHand stand back rods. RUB0PE. POHand standback tbg.

2) PU 5¥4" swedge, bumper sub, oil jars and 4 - 4V4" DC's on 2Va" tbg.
Swedge through tight spot from 7,590'-7,604'. Repeat w/6" and 6Va"
swedge.

3) PU and RIH w/RBP and cementing pkr. Set RBP @ 8,850'. Set pkr andpressure test RBP to 2500 psi. R1s pkr. Spot 2 sxs of sand on RBP. PU
pkr and reset @ ±1,580'. Pressure test csg to 2500 psi. Establishinjection rate into csg leak @7,590'-7,602'.

4) Establish injection into csg leak. Observe csg for signs of
circulation. Squeeze csg to 2500 psig. The number of sxs of cmt to usewill be determined by injection rate (100 sx of cmt per each BPMof
injection rate). Consult w/service company and Denver office for surrydesign. PU on pkr. Reverse circ tbg clean. POH.

5) PU and RIH w/drag bit. DO cmt and pressure test to 2500 psig. Repeat
squeeze if necessary. CO cmt to top of sand. POH.

6) PU and RIH w/retrieving head. Wash sand off RBP, rls BP and POH.

7) TIH w/29's" tbg to TOL @ 10,200'. Attempt to screw into 5½" OD No-Go onTOL. POH if this procedure fails. PU and RIH w/fishing spear to TOL.Spear into No-Go and POH.

8) PU and RIH w/4Va" mill and CO tools. CO 5" liner to PBTD@:±13,292'.

9) RIH w/2Va" tbg, Y-tool & 2Va" sidestring. RIH w/pump and rods. After
production stabilizes, run production log across perfs from 10,608'-13,116'. POH w/sidestring. RIH w/production equipment and return online.

10) Based on information received from production log, prepare AFE to shutwater off and/or perforate and acidize.

SCP:mar
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FoRM O OF UTAH

DMSION OF OIL,GAS AND MINING
5. Laane ossignanonand sedalNumoer:

Fee

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6.WindkMoneewT eName:

N/A
7. Unit Agreement Name:

Do not Use this form for proposals to ddli new wolle. deepen existing wells, o
Use APPUCA110N FOR PEAMIT TO DRILLOR DEEPEN N /A

1. Type of weli: OIL GAS OTHER: MV1 5
8. Well Name and Number:

Lake Fork #2-13B4

2. Name of Operator- 9. API WellNumber

ANR Production Company . .

DMSiON OF 43-013-31134

3. Address and Telephone Numben
LA BAN & MNNG so F-..u m. wa..e

P, O, Box 749 Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Altamont

4. l.acation of Welt

Footno••: 963' FWL & 819' FSL Duchesne

oo.sec..T..R.M.: SW/SW Section 13, T25-R4W sensa: Utah

11 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE N 3TURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENTREPORT
(Suban in Dupiinate) (Subma Original Form Only)

O Abandonment O New Construction O Abandonment 0 New Construction

0 casingRepair O Pull or Alter Casing 0 Casing Repair O Pull or Alter Casing

O Change of Plans O Recompletion O Change of Plans O Shoot or Acidize

0 conversionto ini•©tion O Shoot or Acidize Conversion to injection 0 Vent or Flare

O Fracture Treat O Vent or Flare Fracture Treat O Water Shut-Off

0 Multiple Completion O Water Shut-Off Other In stan Rod Pumo

O Other
Date of work completion 6/10/93

Approximate date work will start Report results of Mumple t' and Renom¢stoons to dinerent reservoks on WEU.
COMPLET10N CA RECOMPLEnoN AND LOG form.

• Must be accarnonnied by a cement verdicabon toport.

12. DESCRIBEPROPOSEDCA COMPLETEDOPERAT10NS K:leany state all peronent details, and give pertinent dates, if well is directionally drilled, give subsurface incadans and measured and true

verocal depths for all markers and zones pertinent in this wartQ

Please see the attached chronological history for the installation of a rod pump on

the above referenced well.

am.asignature: Title: Regulatory Analyst m: /93
leen Danni De

(This apeoe for Stata une only)

-- <se. ensuuenoneon 8.....



THECOASTALCORPORATION
PRODUCTIONREPORT

CHRONOLOGICALHISTORY

LAKEFORK#2-13B4 (INSTALLRODPUMP,RETIRESUBMERSIBLEPUMP) PAGE1
SECTION13, T2S-R4W
ALTAMONTFIELD
DUCHESNECOUNTY,UTAH
WI: 39.22656% ANR AFE: 64588, 64589
TD: 13,300' PBTD: 13,292'
5" LINER @ 10,200'-13,294'
PERFS: 10,608'-13,166' (WASATCH)
CWC(M$): 136.1

4/13/93 LD 2-7/8" DSS-HT. RU, NDWH, NU hydril. Unplug cable. LD hanger.
RU spoolers. POOH& LD 212 jts 2-7/8" DSS-HTtbg. SDFN.
DC: $4,509 TC: $4,509

4/14/93 Cont POOH& LD 95 jts 2-7/8" tbg (307 jts total of DSS-HT) and
submersible BHA. Sent 2-7/8" DSS-HT tbg to PRS to re-cut threads.
ND hydril, NUblind flange. RD rig.
DC: $2,947 TC: $7,456

6/7/93 RIH w/prod BHA. Spot & RU rig. ND blind flange, NU6" 5M BOP. PU
7" 26# cup-type RBP & retr hd, set RBP @ 3020'. Attempt to set @
2954', would not set. Set RSP @ 3020' w/95 jts in hole. Strip off
BOP & dual hanger csg head. Strip on single hanger csg head & BOP.
Test void to 3500#, held. R1s RBP from 3020'. POOH.
DC: $2,551 TC: $10,007

6/8/93 Prep to run rods. PU prod BHA. RIH w/7 jts 2-7/8" FS-150 & 7" 26#
B-2 TAC. RIH w/88 jts out of derrick. PU & RIH w/227 jts FS-150
tbg. Drifted all tbg. Set 7" 26# TAC@ 9896' in 16,000# tension.
PSN @ 10,124' & E0T @ 10,163'. Land hanger. NDBOP, NU prod "T" &
flowline.
DC: $8,230 TC: $18,237

6/9/93 Cont PU rods. PU new 2-1/2" x 1-3/4" x 26' RHBCpump. Run broach
thru tight spot @5'. Pump still hung up @5'. NDprod "T". Rls 7"
26# TACfrom 9896'. CO top jt of 2-7/8" FS-150 tbg. Had small crimp
in jt. Set TAC@9896' in 16,000# tension. Land tbg. NU prod "T".
PU & RIH w/1-3/4" pump, 7 - 1" w/double plus, 128 - 3/4" slick, 6 -

3/4" w/double plus, 3 - 7/8" w/new Huber guide, 130 - 7/8" slick and
15 - 1" rods.
DC: $21,601 TC: $39,838

6/10/93 Final - well producing. Cont PU 1" rods. Have 127 - 1" rods in
well. Seat pump. PT to 500#, held. Good pump action. RD rig.
Turn over to production @ 1:30 p.m. Drop from report.
DC: $19,104 TC:



. Fong a TE OF UTAH
' DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

5. Laase Designation and Serial Number

Fee
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6.Windlan,h orT eName:

N/A
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 7. Unit Agreement Name:

Use APPUCATlON FOR PERMIT TO DAILLOR DEEPEN form for such proposais- N/A
6. Well Name and Number:1. Typ•of W•ll: OIL GAS O OTHER:

Lake Fork #2-13B4
2. Name of Operator 9. API Well Number
ANR Production Company 43-013-31134

3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat·
P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Altamont

4. Location of Well

Footages: 963' FWL & 819' FSL County: Duchesne
QQ,Sec.,f.,R.,M.: SW/SW Section 13-T2S-R4W state: Utah

a CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT

(Submit in Duplicate) (Subadt Original Form Only)

O Abandonment O New Construction O Abandonment O New Construction
O casingRepair O Pull or After casing O casingRepair O Pull or Alter Casing
O Change of Plans O Recompletion O Change of Plans O Shoot or Acidize
O Conversion to injection g Shoot or Acidize O conversionto injection

. O Vent or Flare
O Fracture Treat O Vent or Flare O Fracture Treat O Water Shut-Off
O MultipleCompletion Ë]Water Shut-Off O Other
gjOther CO, Perf

Date of work completion
Approximate date work willstart 4 /30 /94 Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservaks on WELL

COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETIONAND LOG form.
* Must be accompanied ty a cement verificationreport.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent detalis, and give pertinent dates, if well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and trueverticaldepths for all markets and zones pertinent to trais work.)

Please see the attached procedure to CO, water shut off, perf, and acidize in the subject well.

APR 41994

3-
Joe Adamski
Environmental Coord. 3/31/94 -

Name &Signature: Title: Date:

(TMeepaceforStateuseonly)

D 5 TH STATE

(im (See instructions on Aeverse



O e
WASATCH CLEAN OUT, WATER SHUT OFF ADD INFILL PERFS & ACIDIZE PROCEDURE

LAKE FORK 2-13B4
Altamont Field

Duchesne County, Utah
February 28, 1994

WELL DATA

Location: 963' FWL & 819' FSL (SW/SW) Sec 13-T2S-R4W
Spud Date: 11/14/85
Completion Date: 2/10/86
Interests: WI: 17.35156% (ANRPC) 21.875% (COGC 1985-B)

NRI: 15.182775% (ANRPC) 19.140625% (COGC 1985-B)
Elevation: 6,159' GL, 6183' KB
Total Depth: 13,300' PBTD: 13,292'
Casing: 9-5/8", 36#, J-55 ST&C set @ 5000', cmt w/1633 sx, good circ (100 sk top job).

7", 26#, N-80/P-110 LT&C set @ 10,400', cmtd w/1010 sx, partial returns (TOC
@ 4900' CBL 2/6/86).
5", 18#, P-110 FL4S set @ 10,186-13,294', cmtd w/450 sx (goodreturns).

Tubing: 2-7/8" N-80 6.5# EUE @ 10,161'(SN @10,123',TAC @ 9898').

TUBIJLAR DATA

(BPF) (usi) (osi)
Description Interval JJL Drift Capacity Burst Collapse7" 26# N-80 LT&C 0-9,113' 6.276" 6.151" .0382 7,240 5,4107" 26# P-110 LT&C 9,113-10,400' 6.276" 6.151" .0382 9,960 6,2105" 18# P-110 FL4S 10,186-13,294' 4.408N 4.283" .0177 13,940 13,470
2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 EUE 0-10,230' 2.441" 2.347" .00579 10,570 11,160

Current Production: 8 BOPD, 15 MCFPD, 500 BWPD (2/94)

Cement Bond: Good to Excellent 10,200-13,292' (PBTD), Averages very good.

Existing Perfs: Wasatch 10,608-13,166', 510 holes w/3-1/8" csg gun.

WELL HISTORY

February 1986: Initial completion in the Wasatch from 10,608-13,166', 3 SPF, 170', zones, 510
holes, Well IPF'd 857 BOPD, 0 BWPD, 985 MCFD after an 18,000 gal 15% HClacid stimulation.

May 1989: Acidize Wasatch perfs 10,608-13,166' w/ 15,000gal 15% HCI.Raised oil production
from 15 to454
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August 1989: Install submersible pump raising production from 59 to 124 BOPD.

June 1993: Put well on beam pump raising production from 32 to 35 BOPD.

January 1994: Ran production log, found 100% of the water production came from the gross
interval 10,834'-11,302' (500 BWPD).

Cumulative Production: 145,790 BO, 589,390 MCF, and 569,794 BW (12/93)

PROÇEDURE

1. MIRU workover rig. Kill well, POH w/rods & pump. ND WH, NU BOP, Release TAC & POHw/2-7/8" EUE N-80 tbg.

2. PU 4-1/8" mill 5" csg scraper & clean out assembly on tbg and TIH. Clean out 5" liner to ±
11,480'. TOH w/tbg & LD mill, scraper & clean out assembly.

3. MIRU Halliburton. PU and RIH w/5" Selective Injection Pkr (SIP) on 2-3/8" & 2-7/8" tbg.
Spacing between pkr rubbers should be 70'. Set bottom pkr @ 11,325' (CBL depth) and upper
SIP pkr @ 11,255'.

4. Pump 500 gal CaCl2 prepad, 500 gal Clay-Fix II wtr, and 1500 gal Injectrol "U" 200# Cat-III and
1500 gal Injectrol "U" 400# Cat-III followed by 2700 gal Clay-Fix wtr across perforations 11,271-
11,301'. When squeeze in complete, release pkrs & POH & set bottom pkr @ 10,975' (top SIP
pkr @ 10,905'). All depths CBL (Date: 2/6/86)

5. Pump 500 gal CaCl2 prepad, 500 gal Clay-Fix II wtr, and 3000 gal Injectrol "U" 200# Cat-III and
3000 gal Injectrol "U" 400# Cat-III followedby 2650 gal Clay-Fix wtr across perforations 10,912-
10,953'. When squeeze in complete, release pkrs & POH & set bottom pkr @ 10,905' (top SIP
pkr @ 10,835'). All depths CBL (Date: 2/6/86)

6. Pump 500 gal CaCl2 prepad, 500 gal Clay-Fix II wtr, and 1000 gal Injectrol "U" 200# Cat-III and
1000 gal Injectrol "U" 400# Cat-III followed by 2630 gal Clay-Fix wtr across perforations 10,853-
10,893'. When squeeze in complete, release pkrs & POH & set bottom pkr @ 10,835' (top SIP
pkr @ 10,765'). All depths CBL (Date: 2/6/86)

7. Pump 500 gal CaCl2 prepad, 250 gal Clay-Fix II wtr, and 3000 gal Injectrol "U" 200# Cat-III and
3000 gal Injectrol "U" 400# Cat-III followed by 2615 gal Clay-Fix wtr across perforations 10,771-
10,821'. When squeeze in complete, release pkrs, POH & LD SIP pkr assembly.

8. PU 4-1/8" mill 5N CICER Out 3Ssembly on tbg and TIH. Clean out 5" liner to ± 13,292'. TOH
w/tbg & LD mill, scraper & clean out assembly. LD 2-7/8" tbg. Note: Scale is severe, estimate
10 days to clean out to
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9. RU Wireline and perforate Wasatch Formation as per attached schedule, 11,483-13,263', 112 feet,
97 zones, 336 holes w/3-1/8" casing gun. RD Wireline. Note any pressure changes while
perforating.

10. PU 5" HD pkr on 1280' of 2-7/8" & 10,160' 3-1/2" tbg & TIH. Set pkr @ 11,440'.

11. RU stimulation company and acidize Wasatch perforations 11,482-13,263', 612 holes (276 old, 336
new), w/21,000 gal 15% HCL w/600 1.1 S.G. balls and specified additives. MTP 6500 psi.
Attempt to keep csg annulus full during acid treatment.
NOTE: This acid stimulation includes the following:

A) All fluids to be heated to 150 Deg F.

B) Precede acid w/200 bbls 3% KCl wtr w/10 gals per 1000 scale inhibitor and 150 1.1 S.G. balls
evenly spaced followed by 6,000 gal borate x-linked 40# gelled SW** w/1/2 ppg Benzoic acid
flakes and rock salt.

C) Acidize as follows:

1) 7,000 gal of 15% HC1 acid w/1/4 ppg BAF the last 5,000 gal and 150 1.1 balls evenly spaced,
2) 4000 gal borate x-linked 40 # gelled SW** diverter stage with 1/2 ppg Benzoic acid flakes and
rock salt and
3) 7,000 gal of 15% HCl acid w/1/4 ppg BAF the last 5,000 gal HCl and 150 1.1 S.G. balls evenly
spaced.
4) 4000 gal borate x-linked 40 # gelled SW** diverter stage with 1/2 ppg Benzoic acid flakes and
rock salt and
5) 7,000 gal of 15% HC1 acid w/1/4 ppg BAF the last 5,000 gal HCI and 150 1.1 S.G. balls evenly
spaced.

D) No xylene required.

** Attempt to saturate (SW = salt water) to prevent the rock salt from dissolving**

12. Flow/swab back acid load.

13. Release pkr, TOH & LD 3.5" tbg & pkr.

14. PU Gas Anchor,SN, TAC on 2-7/8N EUE tbg & TIH, set TAC @ +/-9,868', SN @ +/-10,123'
& 5" gas anchor @10,161'.ND BOP, NU WH.

15. RIH w|rods & pump. Return well to production.

16. RDMO workover



GREATER ALTAMONT FIELD
ANR LAKE FORK #2-13B4

SVV/4 SEX3.13-T;2S-R4VV
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

PERFORA T/ON SCHEDULE

REFERENCELOG: ATLAS Dual Induction Focused Long, Run #2 (1/12/86)

13,263' 12,916' 12,642' 12,343' 12,015' 11,779'
13,250' 12,909' 12,628' 12,337' 12,009' 11,757'
13,241' 12,898' 12,619' 12,313' 11,991' 11,733'
13,223' 12,889' 12,601' 12,310' 11,982' 11,709'
13,217' 12,886' 12,570' 12,304' 11,976' 11,634'
13,209' 12,869' 12,527' 12,234' 11,969' 11,600'
13,192' 12,852' 12,521' 12,222' 11,951' 11,578'
13,175' 12,844' 12,512' 12,214' 11,912' 11,572'
13,156' 12,834' 12,505' 12,210' 11,903' 11,568'
13,131' 12,813' 12,494' 12,126' 11,896' 11,545'
13,091' 12,807' 12,470' 12,116' 11,878' 11,538'
13,078' 12,801' 12,454' 12,101' 11,875' 11,535'
13,067' 12,762' 12,448' 12,095' 11,867' 11,513'
13,022' 12,746' 12,441' 12,081' 11,849' 11,506'
13,015' 12,723' 12,424' 12,077' 11,843' 11,499'
12,997' 12,705' 12,410' 12,067' 11,834' 11,487'
12,950' 12,691' 12,387' 12,056' 11,829' 11,483'
12,944' 12,673' 12,367' 12,051' 11,814'
12,922' 12,663' 12,357' 12,036' 11,788'

GROSSWASATCHINTERVAL: 11,483-13,263', 336 holes, 112 feet, 97 zones.

R. J. LaRocque
February 28, 1994

RJL:mar
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FORM e TE OF UTAH

IVISION OF DIL,GAS AND MINING
5. Lease Designation and Serial Number

Fee

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6.lfindian,AllotteeorTribeName:

N/A
7. Unit Agreement Name:Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, of to reenter plugged and abandoned wells.

Use APPUCAT10N FOR PEAMIT TO DAILLOR DEEPEN form for such proposals. N/A
1. Type of Well: OIL GAS OTHER: 8. Well Name and Number:

Lake Fork #2-13B4
2. Name of Operator

9. API Well Number

ANR Production Company 43-013-31134
3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 i Altamont
4 Location of Well

Footages: 63' FWL & 819' FSL county: Duchesne
QQ,Sec.,T.,R.,M.:

SW/SW Section 13-T2S-R4w "' Utah

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT

(Submit in Duplieute) (Submit Original Form Only)

O Abandonment O New Construction O Abandonment O New Construction
O casingRepair O Pull or After Casing (RCasing Repair O Pull or Alter Casing
O Change of Plans O Recompletion O Change of Plans O Shoot or Acidize
O conversionto injection O Shoot or Acidize O Conversion to injection

. O Vent or Flare
O Fracture Treat O Vent or Flare O Fracture Treat O Water Shut-Off
O MultipleCompletion O Water Shut-Qff O other
O Other

Date of work completion 2 /8/94
Approximate date work will start Report results of Multiple CompieUone and Rooompletions to different reservolmon WELL

COMPLET10N OR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form.
* Must be accompanied by a cement verification mport.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, if well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and truevertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Please see the attached chronological history for the casing repair procedure performed
on the subject well.

13-
· Joe Adamski

Environmental Coordinator 3/31/94Name & Signature: T Title: Date:

(This speoe for State use on

(12\92) (See instructions on Reverse



III (Ill
THE COASTALCORPORATION

PRODUCTIONREPORT

CHRONOLOGICALHISTORY

LAKEFORK#2-13B4 (REPAIR CSG, RUNPRODUCTIONLOG) PAGE2
SECTION13, T2S-R4W
ALTAMONTFIELD
DUCHESNECOUNTY,UTAH
WI: 39.22656% ANR AFE: 64858
TD: 13,300' PBTD: 13,292'
5" LINER @ 10,200'-13,294'
PERFS: 10,608'-13,166' (WASATCH)
CWC(M$): 158.9

12/17/93 POOHw/rods. RU rig. POOHw/125 - 1" & 30 - Va" rods.
DC: $2,524 TC: $2,524

12/18/93 RIH with 5-15/16" swage. POOHw/103 - Va" & 20 - 14" rods. ND WH,
NU BOP. POOHw/2Va" FS-150 tbg. RIH with 5-15/16" swage, BS, jars,
6 - 454" DC's & accelerator. RIH w/36 jts 2Va" 8rd tbg.
DC: $3,478 TC: $6,002

12/19/93 RIH w/6Va" swage. RIH w/219 jts tbg to 8015', never touched anythingthru tight spot @7590'-7604'. PO0h w/tbg & BHA. RIH w/6Va" swage,
BS, jars, 6 DC's & 60 stds tbg.
DC: $6,343 TC: $12,345

12/20/93 RIH with 5-15/16" swage & screw in sub. RIH w/28 jts 2Va" tbg to
8885' - never touched anything. POOHw/50 stds, hung up w/swage 9
5770'. Swaged on csg for 2 hrs, taking 10,000# to 15,000# to run
swage up & down thru tight spot. Wait 1½ hrs & had to swage csg
back out. POOHw/tbg. Swage was scarred bad all the way around.
DC: $5,788 TC: $18,133

12/21/93 RIH w/RBP & pkr. RIH w/4' tbg sub, 5-15/16" swage, to No-Go on 5" LT
10,200'. Screwed into No-Go. POOHw/tbg & LD No-Go. RIH w/MSOT

7" RBP, 7" pkr & 21 stds.
DC: $29,257 TC: $47,390

12/22/93 POHw/pkr. Set RBP Q 8857' & pkr @8822'. Filled tbg w/38 BW& PT
RBP to 2500 psi, held. Filled csg w/200 BW& PT csg to 2500 psi,
held. Set pkr 9 5492'. Swbd tbg dry. Had 1 bbl feed-in over 4
days.
DC: $4,976 TC: $52,366

12/27/93 Prep to run prod equip. Made 1 swab run to top of pkr @5490' & rec
1 BW. RD swab equip. R1s'd pkr. POOHw/tbg, SN, pkr & retrieving
head. RIH w/retrieving head, SN & tbg. Latch onto & r1s'd RBP @
8857'. POOHw/tbg, SN, retrieving head & RBP.
DC: $4,278 TC: $56,644

12/28/93 RIH w/CO tools. POOH. RIH w/495" mill, 5" cleanout tool, 101 jts 246"
tbg & 113 stds 296" tbg to 10,168'.
DC: $2,988 TC: $59,632

12/29/93 POOHw/CO tools. RIH w/tbg to 10,224'. Milled out hard scale to
10,227' & fell thru. RIH w/tbg to 11,523'. Milled out hard scale to
11,523.5' - mill quit. POOHw/23 stds tbg.
DC: $5,410 TC: $65,042

12/30/93 RIH w/tbg. POOHw/29's" & 246" tbg, CO tool & mill. RIH w/496" drag
bit and CO tool. RIH w/113 stds 296" tbg.
DC: $3,218 TC: $68,260

12/31/93 POOHw/CO tools. RIH w/tbg to 11,523.5'. Milled out hard scale to
11,524.5' in 1-hr & quit. Milled another 4 hrs - no progress. POOH
w/135 stds 2Va" tbg.
DC: $4,925 TC:



(III (Ill
THECOASTALCORPORATION

PRODUCTIONREPORT

CHRONOLOGICALHISTORY

LAKEFORK#2-13B4 (REPAIR CSG, RUNPRODUCTIONLOG) PAGE3
SECTION13, T2S-R4W
ALTAMONTFIELD
DUCHESNECOUNTY,UTAH
WI: 39.22656% ANR AFE: 64858

1/2/94 Reviewing Pennzoil records for details on junk. POOHw/2Va" tbg, COtool & 4Va" drag bit (bit was tapered from 4Va" to 2½"). Indication
of possible junk (pkr, BP, etc.) in hole.
DC: $1,872 TC: $75,057

1/3/94 Prep to mill on pkr @ 11,525'. RIH w/4Va" shoe, pkr plucker, 2 junk
subs, bumper sub & jars. RIH w/2Va" tbg to 11,500'. RUpower swivel.
DC: $4,989 TC: $80,046

1/4/94 RIH w/mill & CO tools. Latched into pkr @ 11,224.5'. Milled over
pkr from 11,524'-11,527'. POOHw/BHA & milled up pkr. RIH w/4Va"
bladed mill, CO tool & 2Va" tbg. RIH w/29'a" tbg, mill @ 6066'.
DC: $6,703 TC: $86,749

1/5/94 POOHw/mill & CO tools. RIH w/tbg, tagged @ 11,524'. Milled out
solid fill to 11,597', fell free to 11,607'. Milled out solid fill
to 11,622' & mill got stuck - tools was plugged. Milled for a total
of 6.5 hrs. POOHw/44 stds 2Va" tbg, mill 9 8786'.
DC: $4,616 TC: $91,365

1/6/94 Prep to COliner. POOHw/2Va" tbg. Changed equip over to 2Va". POOH
w/2Va" tbg, CO tool & mill. Btm 18 jts 2Va" tbg (579') were full of
scale. Pump scale out. RIH w/4Va" drag bit, CO tool & 2Va" tbg.
Changed equip over to 29's". RIH w/2Va" tbg, left bit @ 10,160'.
DC: $3,178 TC: $94,543

1/7/94 POOHw/CO tools. RIH w/2Va" tbg, tagged fill @ 11,392'. CO fill to
11,512'. Started getting sticky, had to pull back up to 11,466'.
Started pmpg wtr down csg. CO fill to 11,615'. Acted like CO tool
plugged. POOHw/55 stds tbg, bit @ 10,068'. (Nota: Pmpd 1300 BW
down csg while milling.)
DC: $5,533 TC: $100,076

1/8/94 RIH w/CO tools. POOHw/CO tool & bit (bit & btm 5 jts tbg (150')
full of scale). RIH w/4Va" drag bit, CO tool & 2Va" tbg - bit @
10,160'.
DC: $2,567 TC: $102,643

1/9/94 POOHw/CO tools. RIH, tagged fill @11,502'. CO fill to 11,639' -

bit plugged. POOHw/25 stds 2Vs" tbg.
DC: $6,090 TC: $108,733

1/10/94 RIH w/tbg. POOHw/tbg, CO tool & bit. Bit & btm 6 jts (193') of tbg
were plugged w/scale. RIH w/4Va" bladed mill & CO tool to 10,130'.
DC: $2,442 TC: $111,175

1/11/94 POOHw/CO tools. RIH w/tbg, tagged fill @ 11,502'. CO scale & fill
to 11,782'. CO tool plugged. POOHto 10,130'.
DC: $4,879 TC: $116,054

1/12/94 RIH w/CO tools. POOHw/2Va" tbg, CO tool & mill. Mill & btm 7 jts
(226') of tbg were full of scale. RIH w/4Va" bladed mill, CO tool &
2Va" tbg. RIH w/2Va" tbg to 10,130'.
DC: $3,015 TC: $119,069

1/13/94 POOHw/CO tools. RIH w/tbg, tagged @ 11,557'. RU power swivel. CO
fill to 11,930'. Mill got stuck. Worked mill up to 11,682' & mill
came free. Milled on fill 9 11,930' for 1½ hrs & did not make any
hole - acted like CO tool was plugged. POOHto 10,130'.
DC: $4,231 TC:



Ill IIII
THE COASTALCORPORATION

PRODUCTIONREPORT

CHRONOLOGICALHISTORY

LAKEFORK#2-1384 (REPAIR CSG, RUNPRODUCTIONLOG) PAGE4
SECTION13, T2S-R4W
ALTAMONTFIELD
DUCHESNECOUNTY,UTAH
WI: 39.22656% ANR AFE: 64858

1/14/94 Change out WH. POOH, LD 197 jts 2Va" tbg. RIH w/51 stds 2Va" tbg.
POOH,LD 139 jts 296" tbg. POOH,LD 101 jts 246" tbg, CO tool & mill
(btm 5 jts 163' of tbg & mill was plugged).
DC: $3,412 TC: $126,712

1/15/94 RIH w/256" tbg. ND BOP, ND single string tbg head. NUdual string
tbg head. NUBOP - tested tbg head void to 5000 psi. RIH w/BHA& 65
stds 2Va" FS-150 to 4200'.
DC: $13,710 TC: $140,422

1/16/94 RIH with 2-1/16" tbg. RIH w/46 stds 2Va" FS-150 tbg. RIH w/81 jts
296" FS-150 tbg. ND BOP, set TAC0 9596' w/SN @ 9517'. Landed tbg
on hanger w/18,000# tension. NU BOP.
DC: $2,231 TC: $142,653

1/17/94 NDBOP, prep to land 2-1/16" sidestring. RIH w/MSOT"T" slot stinger
& 304 jts 2-1/16" FS-150 tbg. Latched into Y-tool 9 9529'.
DC: $2,855 TC: $145,508

1/18/94 RIH w/rods. ND BOP. Spaced out 2-1/16" tbg. Latched into Y-tool @
9529'. Landed 2-1/16" tbg on hanger w/6000# tension. NU WH. RU
Delsco & RIH w/1Va" sinker bars to 9900' (300' below TAC). POOH. RIH
w/new pump (1§í"), 6 - 1" & 94 - §í" rods off ground. RIH w/18 -

14", 133 - Va", 2 - 1" rods.
DC: $2,967 TC: $148,475

1/19/94 Well on production. RIH w/124 - 1" rods. Space out & seat pump. CO
bridle on HH. PT tbg to 500 psi, held. RD rig. Started well pmpg
to flowline.
DC: $11,983 TC: $160,458

1/19/94 Pmpd 55 BO, 247 BW, 0 MCF, 12 SPM, 16 hrs.
1/20/94 Pmpd 40 BO, 516 BW, 2 MCF, 12.5 SPM.
1/21/94 Pmpd 19 BO, 546 BW, 2 MCF, 12 SPM.
1/22/94 Pmpd 13 BO, 384 BW, 4 MCF, 12 SPM.
1/23/94 Pmpd 17 BO, 499 BW, 2 MCF, 12 SPM.
1/24/94 Pmpd 17 BO, 521 BW, 27 MCF, 12 SPM. Will allow production to

stabilize, then run a production log.
1/25/94 Pmpd 19 80, 563 BW, 28 MCF, 12 SPM.
1/26/94 Pmpd 12 BO, 513 BW, 28 MCF, 12 SPM.
1/27/94 Pmpd 36 BO, 519 BW, 45 MCF, 12 SPM.
1/28/94 Pmpd 11 80, 521 BW, 52 MCF, 12 SPM.
1/29/94 Pmpd 10 80, 467 BW, 61 MCF, 12 SPM.
1/30/94 Pmpd 7 BO, 458 BW, 58 MCF, 12 SPM. Plan to run production log today.
1/31/94 Pmpd 6 BO, 458 BW, 43 MCF. Ran production log, found 75% of wtr in

interval @ 10,771'-10,954'.
2/1/94 Pmpd 15 BO, 493 BW, 25 McF.

Prior prod: 0 BO, 0 BW, 0 MCF. Will prep AFE to squeeze off wtr.
Final
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2/5/94 LD 2-1/16".
RU rig. POOHw/rods & pump. Jar out of Y-tool. Install B0P's. LD
30 jts 2-1/16" FS-150. CC: $3,295

2/6/94 POOHw/BHA.
LD 273 jts 2-1/16" FS-lSO. Release 7" anchor. POOHw/280 jts 2Va"FS-150. CC: $6,126

2/7/94 RIH w/2Va".
Finish POOHw/2Va". Remove B0P's, dual tbg spool. Install single
string tbg spool. PT to 3000 psi. Install BOP's. RIH with 5-15/16"
0D bladed No-Go, 4½" PBGA,4' 2Va" sub, SN, 7 jts 2Vs" FS-150, 7" Mtn
States AC, 258 jts 2Va" FS-150, drifting every 20 jts, E0T @8200'.
CC: $11,070

2/8/94 Well on production.
Continue to RIH w/2Va", remove B0P's. Set anchor @10,122' w/18,000#
tension, SN @ 9898'. RIH w/Nat'1 1V4" pump, 7 - 1" w/guide, 133 -

¼", 133 - Va", 128 - 1". Space out. PT to 500 psi. RD equip.
Final report. CC:
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Fee
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. Una Agreement Name:

00 not use &tis form for proposals to drm new wens, deepen emmlingwens, or to reenter plugged and aDandoned weds.us. ApeucAnom FoA PERWT TO ORD. OA OEEPEN form for e proposals. N/A1. Type of Weß: OIL GAS O OTHER: 8. Wed Name and Number:

Lake Fork #2-13842. Name of Operator

9. API Well Number
ANR Production Company

43-013-311343. Address and Telephone Number

10. Field and Poal, or Wideat:
P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Altamont4. Location of Weil

voce.g..: 963' FWL & 819' FSL
county: DuchesneSW/SW Section 13-T2S-R4W

Utah
1 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATANOTICE OF INTENT

SUBSEQUENTREPORT(sue..nin oupu..se
(sue..aorigin.iFer. oney)O Abandonment O New Construction O Abandonment O New ConstructionO casingRepair O Puu or After casino O casingRepair O Pull or Alter casingO changeof Plans O RecomPi•tion 0 Change of Plans g Shoot or AcidizeO conversionto injection O Shoot or Acidize 0 c nversion to ini•ction 0 Vent or FlareO Fracture Treat O Vent or Flare racture Treat Water Shut-OffO Multiple Completion O Water Shut-OH Other CO , Per fO other

Date of work completion 6 /5 /94Approximate date work will start
Report resuas of Muni¢œ e-R and Reconspiedene to diferert leservoirs on WERcoueumON OA RECOMPLEDON ANDLOG funn,

12. DESCRIBEPADPOSEDCA COMPLETEDOPERADONS(Clearlystate ai pergnent detana, and give pedinent dalea &weg is direcdonair dr¾ed, ghe subsurface locadone and measured and bue
vertical depths for si markers and annes pertinert to 1Ns work)

Please see the attached chronological history for work performed in the subject well.

11

N.O. ShiflettNarne&Signatuge•
Dist. Drlg. Manager 6/29/94

¯

(12W2þ
(See instruceans on neverse
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WI: 39.22656% ANR AFE: 00141
TD: 13,300' PBTD: 13,292'
5" LINER @ 10,186'-13,294'
PERFS: 10,608'-13,166' (WASATCH)
CWC(MS): 167.0

4/7/94 POOHw/tbg.
MIRUworkover rig. POOHw/rods & pump. NO flow tee, NU BOP. R1sAC @9898'. POOHw/140 jts 2Va" FS-150 tbg. CC: 53,885

4/8/94 RIH w/CO tools.
POOHw/l82 jts 2Va" FS-150 tbg. LD BHA. RIH w/4Va" mill, csgscraper, CO assembly, 45 jts 2¥a" tbg & 264 jts 29's" 8rd tbg to9928'. CC: $7844

4/9-10/94 SD for weekend.

4/11/94 RIH w/selective injection pkr to sqz off wtr.
RIH w/2Vs". Tag fill @ 11,525'. CO to 11,540'. POOHw/2Va". LD COassembly, csg scraper & 4Va" mill. Btm 3 jts plugged w/fmn, scale &cmt. CC: $12,722

4/12/94 RIH w/OS.
PU SIP tool w/70' spacing between pkr rubbers. RIH w/SIP, 36 jts2Va" tbg & 316 jts 2Va" tbg to 11,341'. (No_tg: Had to work tbg for1½ hrs to get dual pkr in 5" liner.) Correlate tbg depth w/CBL.POOH w/2Va" tbg @ 10,566'. Were unable to set SIP tool to PT, POOHw/tbg. Left top pkr, 2 jts 2Va" tbg & btm pkr in hole. Connectionsloosened while trying to work pkrs into TOL. CC: $18,623

4/13/94 Continue to jar in SIP tool.
RIH w/OS. Latch onto fish (SIP tool) @ 11,429'. POOHw/2Va" tbg.Btm pkr on SIP tool would not pull passed LT @ 10,186'. Attempt tojar pkr thru LT. (Pkr OD - 4-1/16", liner hanger ID 4-1/8".) CC:$25,726

4/14/94 Fish fluid release valve.
Continue to jar on btm of fish @ 10,218' (btm pkr). Could not pullthru liner hanger. Ris OS (TOF @ 10,145'). POOHw/283 jts 2Va" tbg.RU Delsco. Made 2 attempts to fish fluid r1s valve in pkr top w/Va"grapple - no success. CC: $31,980

4/15/94 RU Delsco to run depth check.
RU Delsco. Fish fluid rls valve @ 10,145' w/1Va" 05. PU & RIH with3-9/16" 03, bumper sub, jars, accelerator sub & 6 - 4¾" DC's.Latch onto fish, top @ 10,145'. Jar fish. POOHw/tbg, BHA, toppkr, 2 jts 2Va" tbg & 1.42' of btm pkr; 2.52' remaining in wellincluding pack-off, setting element & drag blocks. CC: $41,592

4/16/94 RIH w/spear.
RU Oelsco. RIH, tag @ 10,200'. POOH w/same. RD Delsco. CC:$43,483

4/17/94 SD for Sunday.

4/18/94 Fishing pkr.
RIH w/1Va" spear, 1 - 3Va" DC, jars, bumper sub, 6 - 4¾" DC's & 27A"
tbg. RIH to TOF G 10,218'. Latch onto fish & work out of liner.Fish appeared to pull thru liner. POOHw/tbg & BHA. Grapple onspear was stripped - no fisK. CC:
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4/19/94 RIH w/spear.
RU Delsco. RIH with 3-5/16" magnet with 3-15/16" skirt. Tag 5"liner @ 10,200', tag fish @ 10,243'. POOHw/same - did not recpiece of rope socket. Remove 3-15/16" skirt. RIH w/same results.RDDelsco. RIH w/2.023" grapple on spear, bumper sub, jars, 6 - 3Va"DC's, 43 jts 2Va" tbg & 164 jts 2Va" tbg to 6638'. CC: $54,340

4/20/94 Prep to dress up 5" liner.
RIH w/110 jts 2Vs" tbg, tag fish @ 10,511'. Latch onto fish. POOHto 10,211', fish hung up in liner lap. Jar thru liner hanger @10,200'. POOHw/tbg & fish (btm 2.51' of SIP tool, Va" x 8.5" barwrapped around spear). LO fish. RIH w/4.151" string mill, jars,bumper sub, 6 - 4¾" DC's & 309 jts 29'a" tbg to 10,190'. CC: $60,998

4/21/94 WOtools.
Dress 5" liner from 10,200' to 10,218' w/no visible restriction.Pump 550 bb1s fmn wtr down csg. Unable to est circ. POOHw/310 jts2Va" tbg. LD string mill. CC: 565,096

4/22/94 RIH w/SIP pkr assembly to sqz off wtr.
Ordered out replacement sqz pkrs.

4/23-24/94 SD for weekend.

4/25/94 Move pkr to 11,325', prep to squeeze.
PU 5" Mtn States Strada-set pkr. RIH w/36 jts 2Va" tbg & 286 jts2Vs" tbg (no problem getting in 5" liner). Set pkr @ 10,367'. Filltbg w/36 BW& test to 1000#, held. RU Cutters. RIH w/GR, correlatetbg w/CBL using -6' correction. RD Cutters. CC: $71,741

4/26/94 Prep to POOHw/pkr assembly.
Isolated & chemically sqz'd off wtr in zones as follows:

Perf Interval Pkri
11,271'-11,301' 11,250'-11,321'
10,912'-10,953' 10,895'-10,965'
10,853'-10,893' 10,832'-10,904'
10,771'-10,821' 10,762'-10,833'

Sqz'd w/17,000 gal Injectrol "U" & 12,500 gal Clay-Fix @ 2-5 BPM@0-1100#. Pull out of 5" liner to 9306'. CC: 589,891

4/27/94 CO 5" liner.
Pump 245 bb1s fmn wtr @ 5 BPM9 600# to est circ. Circ for 10 minw/3-4 BPMreturns to tank. POOHw/254 jts 256" tbg & 36 jts 2Va"tbg. LDStrada-set pkr assembly. RIH w/4Va" drag bit, 53 Jts 244"tbg & 265 jts 2Va" tbg, to 10,562'. CC: $94,696

4/28/94 Continue CO fill 9 11,721'.
Tag fill @ 11,500'. Pump 240 bb1s fmn wtr to est circ. DO to11,721' (221')/10 hr w/heavy scale & fmn in returns. Had problems
w/drag bit plugging. Circ down annulus @ 5 BPMw/80% returns, PP800-1000#. POOHw/34 jts above liner to 10,562'. (Notg: Total wtr
loss for day - 960 bb1s.) CC: $100,383

4/29/94 POOHto change out 4Va" drag bit.
RIH w/26 jts 29's" tbg, tag fill @ 11,660'. Pump 290 bb1s to est
circ. DOfrom 11,660'-11,695'. Rubber & metal shavings in returns.
Circ clean. POOHw/46 jts 2Va" tbg. CC:
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4/30-5/1/94 SD for weekend.

5/2/94 Continue to CO.
POOHw/263 jts 29'a" tbg, 43 jts 2Va" tbg & drag bit. No visibledamage to btm of drag bit. RIH w/4Va" × lVa" full open drag bit, 43jts 2Va" tbg & 309 jts 2Va" tbg. Tag fill @ 11,680'. DO from11,680'-11,725'. Heavy fmn in returns. Circ clean. POOHw/34 jts.CC: $109,011

5/3/94 Continue to CO 5" liner @ 11,756'.
RIH w/34 jts 2Va" tbg. Tag fill @ 11,715'. Pump 360 bbis fmn wtr toest circ. DO from 11,715'-11,756'. Had oil & gas kick @ approx11,750'. Drag bit still plugging. Circ clean. POOHw/35 jts to10,562'. Cire down annulus w/5 BPM@ 600#, getting 3 BPMback. CC:5114,382

5/4/94 POOHw/drag bit.
RIH w/34 jts 2Va" tbg, tag fill @ 11,721'. Pump 380 BW to est circ.00 from 11,721' to 11,800'. Drag bit plugged - unable to clear bit.POOH(wet) w/48 jts 2Va" to 10,160'. Rev circ @5 BPM, 600# w/50-60%returns. Will CO fill. CC: $120,624

5/5/94 Continue to cleanout.
POOH w/265 jts 2Va" & drag bit. Btm 3 jts & drag bit were plugged.Open ports on bit to 1½" 00. RIH w/4Va" drag & tbg. Tag fill @11,785'. Pump 36 bbis fmn wtr to est circ. DO from 11,785' to11,876' (93')/3 hrs. Circ clean. POOH w/40 jts tbg. CC: $125,473

5/6/94 Continue to cleanout.
RIH w/40 jts 2Vs" tbg. Tag fill @ 11,861'. Pump 360 BWto est circ.DO from 11,861' to 12,139' (278') w/heavy fluid loss, 5 BPM pumprate, l'A BPMreturning to tank. Circ clean. Pull out of 5" linerto 10,160'. CC: $132,562

5/7-8/94 SD for weekend.

5/9/94 RIH, check fill.
RIH w/50 jts 2Va" tbg. Tag fill @ 12,120'. Pump 360 BWto est circ.CO from 12,120' to PBTD @ 13,292' (1172')/10½ hrs. Using twopumps, rev circ @ 8 BPMw/50% returns. Circ clean. POOHw/83 jts2Va" tbg to 10,562'. CC: 5139,902

5/10/94 RIH w/production string.
RIH w/83 jts, tag PBTD@ 13,292' (no fill). LD 364 jts 2Va" tbg, 53jts 2Va" tbg & drag bit. CC: $143,437

5/11/94 RIH w/remaining rods, return to production.
PU BHA& Mtn States 7" AC. RIHw/same & 322 jts 2Va" FS-150 tbg. NDBOP. Set AC @ 9895', SN @ 10,119'. AC set w/18,000# tension. RIHw/l¾" recond pump, 7 - 1" rods & 133 ¥4" rods. CC: $146,587

5/12/94 Well on pump.
RIH w/133 - Va" & 128 - 1" rods. Seat pump, test to 500# (held).Hang well on & return to production. RD workover rig. CC: $156,704

5/12/94 Pmpd 3 BO, 456 BW, 6 HCF, 19 hrs.

5/13/94 Pmpd 21 BO, 602 BW, 4 MCF.

5/14/94 Pmpd 33 80, 596 BW, 39
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5/15/94 Pmpd 54 80, 513 BW, 49 McF.

5/16/94 Pmpd 71 80, 533 BW, 47 McF.

5/17/94 Pmpd 64 80, 529 BW, 43 MCF, 12 SPM.

5/18/94 Pmpd 40 80, 556 BW, 34 MCF, 12 SPM.

5/19/94 Pmpd 38 80, 466 BW, 34 MCF, 12 SPM.
5/20/94 Pmpd 55 80, 498 BW, 31 MCF.

5/21/94 Pmpd 43 80, 598 BW, 31 MCF.

5/22/94 Pmpd 26 80, 542 BW, 28 MCF, 12 SPM.
5/23/94 Pmpd 46 BW, 540 BW, 31 MCF, 12 SPM.
5/24/94 Pmpd 22 BO, 484 BW, 28 MCF, 12 SPM.
5/25/94 Pmpd 25 80, 496 BW, 31 MCF.

5/26/94 Pmpd 23 80, 546 BW, 28 MCF.

5/27/94 Pmpd 5 80, 754 BW, 25 McF.

5/28/94 Pmpd 12 80, 401 BW, 32 MCF.

5/29/94 Pmpd 26 BO, 557 BW, 32 MCF.
5/30/94 Pmpd 18 80, 472 BW, 28 MCF, 12 SPM,
5/31/94 Pmpd 15 BO, 543 BW, 26 MCF, 12 SPM.

6/1/94 Pmpd 26 BO, 551 BW, 26 MCF.

6/2/94 Pmpd 21 80, 531 BW, 24 McF.

6/3/94 Pmpd 17 BO, 576 BW, 24 MCF.

6/4/94 Pmpd 18 BO, 535 BW, 23 MCF.

6/5/94 Pmpd 15 80, 545 BW, 23 McF.
Will drop from report & evaluate further
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DIVISION Gr IL,GAS AND MINING

5. Lease Designadon and Serial Number
Fee

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS ,AllotleeorTribeName:

7. Unit Agreement Name:Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells,or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells.
Use APPUCATlON FOR PERMFTTO DRILLOR DEEPEN form for such proposals. N/A

1. Type of Well: OIL GAS OTHER: 6. WellName and Number:

Lake Fork #2-13B4
2. Name of Operator: 9. API Well Number:ANR Production Company 43-013-31134
3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Altamont
4. Locationof Well

Footages: 963' FWL & 819' FSL county: Duchesne
SW/SW Section 13-T2S-R4W Utahoo, see.,T..n.,M.: State:

n· CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE URE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT

(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

O Abandonment O New Construction O Abandonment O New Construction
O casingRepair O Pull or Alter Casing O Casing Repair O Pull or Alter Casing
O Change of Plans O Recompletion O Change of Plans g Shoot or Acidize
O conversionto injection O Shoot or Acidize O conversionto injection O Vent or Flare
O Fracture Treat O ventor Flar• O Fracture Treat Water Shut-Off
O Multiplecompletion 0 Water Shut-Off D Other CO, Perf

O Other

Date of work completion 6 /5 /94
Approximate date work will start Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirson WELL

COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETlON ANDLOGform.
* Must be accompanied by a cement verificationreport.

12. DESCRIBEPADPOSEDOA COMPLETEDOPERATIONS (Clearlystate all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, if well Is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and truevertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Please see the attached chronological history for work performed in the subject well.

la N.0. Shiflett
Name&Signature: / / Title: Dist. Drlg. Manager osia:

(This spone for State use only)

(12\92) (See instructions on Aeverse
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5/15/94 Pmpd 54 BO, 513 BW, 49 MCF.

5/16/94 Pmpd 71 BO, 533 BW, 47 MCF.

5/17/94 Pmpd 64 80, 529 BW, 43 MCF, 12 SPM.

5/18/94 Pmpd 40 BO, 556 BW, 34 MCF, 12 SPM.

5/19/94 Pmpd 38 BO, 466 BW, 34 MCF, 12 SPM.

5/20/94 Pmpd 55 BO, 498 BW, 31 MCF.

5/21/94 Pmpd 43 BO, 598 BW, 31 MCF.

5/22/94 Pmpd 26 BO, 542 BW, 28 MCF, 12 SPM.

5/23/94 Pmpd 46 BW, 540 BW, 31 MCF, 12 SPM.

5/24/94 Pmpd 22 BO, 484 BW, 28 MCF, 12 SPM.

5/25/94 Pmpd 25 BO, 496 BW, 31 MCF.

5/26/94 Pmpd 23 BO, 546 BW, 28 MCF.

5/27/94 Pmpd 5 BO, 754 BW, 25 MCF.

5/28/94 Pmpd 12 BO, 401 BW, 32 MCF.

5/29/94 Pmpd 26 BO, 557 BW, 32 MCF.

5/30/94 Pmpd 18 BO, 472 BW, 28 MCF, 12 SPM.

5/31/94 Pmpd 15 BO, 543 BW, 26 MCF, 12 SPM.

6/1/94 Pmpd 26 BO, 551 BW, 26 MCF.

6/2/94 Pmpd 21 BO, 531 BW, 24 MCF.

6/3/94 Pmpd 17 BO, 576 BW, 24 MCF.

6/4/94 Pmpd 18 BO, 535 BW, 23 MCF.

6/5/94 Pmpd 15 BO, 545 BW, 23 MCF.
Will drop from report & evaluate further
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4/30-5/1/94 SD for weekend.

5/2/94 Continue to CO.
POOHw/263 jts 2Vs" tbg, 43 jts 2¥s" tbg & drag bit. No visible
damage to btm of drag bit. RIH w/4Va" x 1Va" full open drag bit, 43
jts 2Va" tbg & 309 jts 2Va" tbg. Tag fill @ 11,680'. 00 from
11,680'-11,725'. Heavy fmn in returns. Circ clean. POOHw/34 jts.
CC: $109,011

5/3/94 Continue to CO 5" liner @ 11,756'.
RIH w/34 jts 2Va" tbg. Tag fill @11,715'. Pump 360 bb1s fmn wtr to
est circ. D0 from 11,715'-11,756'. Had oil & gas kick @ approx
11,750'. Drag bit still plugging. Circ clean. POOHw/35 jts to
10,562'. Circ down annu1us w/5 BPM@600#, getting 3 BPMback. CC:
$114,382

5/4/94 POOHw/drag bit.
RIH w/34 jts 2Va" tbg, tag fill @ 11,721'. Pump 380 BWto est circ.
D0 from 11,721' to 11,800'. Drag bit plugged - unable to clear bit.
POOH(wet) w/48 jts 2Va" to 10,160'. Rev circ @5 BPM, 600# w/50-60°/o
returns. Will CO fill. CC: $120,624

5/5/94 Continue to cleanout.
POOHw/265 jts 2Va" & drag bit. Btm 3 jts & drag bit were plugged.
Open ports on bit to 1½" 0D. RIH w/4Va" drag & tbg. Tag fill @
11,785'. Pump 36 bb1s fmn wtr to est circ. D0 from 11,785' to
11,876' (93')/3 hrs. Circ clean. POOHw/40 jts tbg. CC: $125,473

5/6/94 Continue to cleanout.
RIH w/40 jts 25's" tbg. Tag fill @11,861'. Pump 360 BWto est circ.
D0 from 11,861' to 12,139' (278') w/heavy fluid loss, 5 BPM pump
rate, 1¼ BPMreturning to tank. Circ clean. Pull out of 5" liner
to 10,160'. CC: $132,562

5/7-8/94 SD for weekend.

5/9/94 RIH, check fill.
RIH w/50 jts 29's" tbg. Tag fill @ 12,120'. Pump 360 BWto est circ.
CO from 12,120' to PBTD @ 13,292' (1172')/10½ hrs. Using two
pumps, rev circ @ 8 BPMw/50%returns. Circ clean. POOHw/83 jts
2Vs" tbg to 10,562'. CC: $139,902

5/10/94 RIH w/production string.
RIH w/83 jts, tag PBTD@ 13,292' (no fill). LD 364 jts 2Va" tbg, 53
jts 2Va" tbg & drag bit. CC: $143,437

5/11/94 RIH w/remaining rods, return to production.
PU BHA& Mtn States 7" AC. RIH w/same & 322 jts 2Va" FS-150 tbg. ND
BOP. Set AC @ 9895', SN @ 10,119'. AC set w/18,000# tension. RIH
w/1¾" recond pump, 7 - 1" rods & 133 ¥4" rods. CC: $146,587

5/12/94 Well on pump.
RIH w/133 - Vs" & 128 - 1" rods. Seat pump, test to 500# (held).
Hang well on & return to production. RDworkover rig. CC: $156,704

5/12/94 Pmpd 3 BO, 456 BW, 6 MCF, 19 hrs.

5/13/94 Pmpd 21 BO, 602 BW, 4 MCF.

5/14/94 Pmpd 33 BO, 596 BW, 39
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4/19/94 RIH w/spear.
RU Delsco. RIH with 3-5/16" magnet with 3-15/16" skirt. Tag 5"
liner @ 10,200', tag fish @ 10,243'. POOHw/same - did not rec
piece of rope socket. Remove 3-15/16" skirt. RIH w/same results.
RDDel sco. RIH w/2.023" grapple on spear, bumper sub, jars, 6 - 3Va"
DC's, 43 jts 2Va" tbg & 164 jts 2Va" tbg to 6638'. CC: $54,340

4/20/94 Prep to dress up 5" liner.
RIH w/110 jts 2Va" tbg, tag fish @ 10,511'. Latch onto fish. POOH
to 10,211', fish hung up in liner lap. Jar thru liner hanger @
10,200'. POOHw/tbg & fish (btm 2.51' of SIP tool, Va" x 8.5" bar
wrapped around spear). LD fish. RIH w/4.151" string mill, jars,
bumper sub, 6 - 4¥4" DC's & 309 jts 2Vs" tbg to 10,190'. CC: $60,998

4/21/94 WOtools.
Dress 5" liner from 10,200' to 10,218' w/no visible restriction.
Pump 550 bb1s fmn wtr down csg. Unable to est circ. POOHw/310 jts
2Va" tbg. LD string mill. CC: $65,096

4/22/94 RIH w/SIP pkr assembly to sqz off wtr.
Ordered out replacement sqz pkrs.

4/23-24/94 SD for weekend.

4/25/94 Move pkr to 11,325', prep to squeeze.
PU 5" Mtn States Strada-set pkr. RIH w/36 jts 2¥a" tbg & 286 jts
2Va" tbg (no problem getting in 5" liner). Set pkr @ 10,367'. Fill
tbg w/36 BW& test to 1000#, held. RU Cutters. RIH w/GR, correlate
tbg w/CBL using -6' correction. RD Cutters. CC: $71,741

4/26/94 Prep to POOHw/pkr assembly.
Isolated & chemically sqz'd off wtr in zones as follows:

Perf Interval Pkrs
11,271'-11,301' 11,250'-11,321'
10,912'-10,953' 10,895'-10,965'
10,853'-10,893' 10,832'-10,904'
10,771'-10,821' 10,762'-10,833'

Sqz'd w/17,000 gal Injectrol "U" & 12,500 gal Clay-Fix @ 2-5 BPM@
0-1100#. Pull out of 5" liner to 9306'. CC: $89,891

4/27/94 CO 5" liner.
Pump 245 bb1s fmn wtr @ 5 BPM@ 600# to est circ. Circ for 10 min
w/3-4 BPMreturns to tank. POOHw/254 jts 2Va" tbg & 36 jts 2Va"
tbg. LD Strada-set pkr assembly. RIH w/4Va" drag bit, 53 jts 2Va"
tbg & 265 jts 2Va" tbg, to 10,562'. CC: $94,696

4/28/94 Continue CO fill @ 11,721'.
Tag fill @ 11,500'. Pump 240 bb1s fmn wtr to est circ. DO to
11,721' (221')/10 hr w/heavy scale & fmn in returns. Had problems
w/drag bit plugging. Circ down annulus @ 5 BPMw/80% returns, PP
800-1000#. POOHw/34 jts above liner to 10,562'. (Note: Total wtr
loss for day - 960 bbls.) CC: $100,383

4/29/94 POOHto change out 4Va" drag bit.
RIH w/26 jts 2Va" tbg, tag fill @ 11,660'. Pump 290 bbls to est
circ. DOfrom 11,660'-11,695'. Rubber & metal shavings in returns.
Circ clean. POOHw/46 jts 2Va" tbg. CC:
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TD: 13,300' PBTO: 13,292'
5" LINER @ 10,186'-13,294'
PERFS: 10,608'-13,166' (WASATCH)
CWC(M$): 167.0

4/7/94 POOHw/tbg.
MIRUworkover rig. POOHw/rods & pump. ND flow tee, NU BOP. R1s
AC @ 9898'. POOHw/140 jts 2Va" FS-150 tbg. CC: $3,885

4/8/94 RIH w/CO tools.
POOHw/182 jts 2Va" FS-150 tbg. LD BHA. RIH w/4Va" mill, csg
scraper, CO assembly, 45 jts 2¥s" tbg & 264 jts 2Va" 8rd tbg to
9928'. CC: $7844

4/9-10/94 SD for weekend.

4/11/94 RIH w/selective injection pkr to sqz off wtr.
RIH w/2Va". Tag fill @ 11,525'. CO to 11,540'. POOHw/2Vs". LD C0
assembly, csg scraper & 4Vs" mill. Btm 3 jts plugged w/fmn, scale &
cmt. CC: $12,722

4/12/94 RIH w/OS.
PU SIP tool w/70' spacing between pkr rubbers. RIH w/SIP, 36 jts
2Va" tbg & 316 jts 2Va" tbg to 11,341'. (Note: Had to work tbg for
1½ hrs to get dual pkr in 5" liner.) Correlate tbg depth w/CBL.
POOHw/2Va" tbg @ 10,566'. Were unable to set SIP tool to PT. POOH
w/tbg. Left top pkr, 2 jts 2¥s" tbg & btm pkr in hole. Connections
loosened while trying to work pkrs into TOL. CC: $18,623

4/13/94 Continue to jar in SIP tool.
RIH w/OS. Latch onto fish (SIP tool) @ 11,429'. POOHw/29's" tbg.
Btm pkr on SIP tool would not pull passed LT @ 10,186'. Attempt to
jar pkr thru LT. (Pkr 0D - 4-1/16", liner hanger ID 4-1/8".) CC:
$25,726

4/14/94 Fish fluid release valve.
Continue to jar on btm of fish @ 10,218' (btm pkr). Could not pull
thru liner hanger. Rls OS (TOF @10,145'). POOHw/283 jts 2Va" tbg.
RU Del sco. Made 2 attempts to fish fluid rls valve in pkr top w/Va"
grapple - no success. CC: $31,980

4/15/94 RU Delsco to run depth check.
RU Del sco. Fish fluid rls valve @ 10,145' w/1Va" 0S. PU & RIH with
3-9/16" 05, bumper sub, jars, accelerator sub & 6 - 4¾" DC's.
Latch onto fish, top @ 10,145'. Jar fish. POOHw/tbg, BHA, top
pkr, 2 jts 2Va" tbg & 1.42' of btm pkr; 2.52' remaining in well
including pack-off, setting element & drag blocks. CC: $41,592

4/16/94 RIH w/spear.
RU Delsco. RIH, tag @ 10,200'. POOHw/same. RD Delsco. CC:
$43,483

4/17/94 SD for Sunday.

4/18/94 Fishing pkr.
RIH w/lVa" spear, 1 - 3Va" DC, jars, bumper sub, 6 - 4¥4" DC's & 2Va"
tbg. RIH to TOF @ 10,218'. Latch onto fish & work out of liner.
Fish appeared to pull thru liner. POOHw/tbg & BHA. Grapple on
spear was stripped - no fish. CC:



FORM 9. ATE OF UTAH
DIVISIO OIL, GAS AND MINING

5. Lease Designation a Number:

See Attached
6. If indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS See Attached

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 7. Unit Agreement Name:
Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLOR DEEPEN form for such proposals. See Attached

1. Type of Well:
8. Well Name and Number:

OlL GAS OTHER: See Attached
2. Name of Operator: 9. API Well Number:

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation See Attached
3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573--4455 See Attached
4. Location of Well

Footages: See Attached County: See Attached
QQ, Sec , T., R., M.: See Attached stato: Utah

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT

(Submit in Diplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

Abandon New Construction Abandon * New Construction
Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing Repair Casing [¯¯]

Pull or Alter Casing
Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans Perforate
Convertto injection Perforate Convertto Injection Vent or Flare
Fracture Treat or Acidize Vent or Flare Fracture Treat or Acidize Water Shut-Off

Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off [X ] Other Change of Operator
Other

Date of work completion

Approximate date work willstart Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verificationreport.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and truevertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to thiswork.)

Please be advised that effective December 27, 1995,ANR Production Company relinquished and Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation
assumed operations for the subject wells (see attached). Bond coverage pursuant to 43 CFR 3104 for lease activities is being
provided by Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation under the following bonds: State of Utah #102103, BLM Nationwide Bond#U605382-9, and BIA Nationwide Bond #11-40-66A. Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation, as operator, agrees to be responsible
under the terms and conditions of the leases for the operations conducted upon leased lands.

B nie Carson, Sr. Environmental & Safety AnÀlyst
ANR Production Company OF OIL, GAS & MININ

la. Sheila Bremer
Environmental & Safety Analyst

Name & Signature:
_ Title: Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation __

oate: 03/07/96

(This space for State use only)

(5/94) (See Instructions on Reverse
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United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO:
UT-922

April 11, 1996

Memorandum

TO: Superintendent, Uintah and Ouray Agency, Ft. Duchesne, Utah

FROM: Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals, BLM, Utah State Office, Salt Lake City, Utah

SUBJECT: Successor of Operator, Communitization Agreement's (CA) 96-000018, 96-
000023, 96-000035, 96-000039, 96-000040, 96-000042, 96-000043, 96-000045,
96-000046, 96-000049, 96-000054, 96-000055, 96-000056, 96-000059, 96-
000060, 96-000061, 96-000070, 96-000071, 96-000072, 96-000074, 96-000078,
96-000079, 96-000081, 96-000085, 96-000104, 9C-000126, 9C-000133, 9C-
000138, 9C-000140, UTO80l49-87C696, UT70814, UTU73743 and UTU73964,
Duchesne and Uintah Counties, Utah

The enclosed Designation of Successor of Operators for CA's 96-000018, 96-000023,
96-000035, 96-000039, 96-000040, 96-000042, 96-000043, 96-000045, 96-000046,
96-000049, 96-000054, 96-000055, 96-000056, 96-000059, 96-000060, 96-000061,
96-000070, 96-000071, 96-000072, 96-000074, 96-000078, 96-000079, 96-000081,
96-000085, 96-000104, 9C-000126, 9C-000133, 9C-000138, 9C-000140, UTO80l49-87C696,
UT70814, UTU73743 and UTU73964, Duchesne and Uintah Counties, Utah, have been
reviewed by this office and found to be acceptable and we recommend approval. The new
operator willbe Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation. Upon approval of these Successor of
Operators, please return one copy to this office,

if you have any questions, please contact Teresa Thompson at (801) 539-4047.

Enclosures

CA 's (33)
DM - Vernal
plyisignOilAGas & Mining
Agr. Sec. Chron.
Fluid Chron



g SITED STATES GOVERNMENT

memorandum
DATE: August 16, 1996

REPLY TO
ATTN OF:

Superintendent, Uintah and Ouray Agency
SUBJECT:

Designation of Successor Operator

TO:

Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

We are in receipt of the Designations of Successor Operator for our approval whereby Coastal
Oil & Gas Corporation was designated as the new Operator for the Communization Agreements
(CA) listed on-the attached sheet, Exhibit "A".

The enclosed instruments were approved on the date of this letter. Coastal's Nationwide Bond
will be used to cover all operations, and plugging and abandonment of wells.

If you have any questions, please contact this office at (801) 722-2406, Ext. 51/52/54.

Enclosures

Theresa Thompson, BLM/SLC

AUG2 0 1996

DIV.OFOIL,GAS& MINING

OPTIONAL FORM NO. t0
(REV. 1-80)
GSA FPMR (41 CFR) 101-11.6
5010-114
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DESIGNATION OF SUCCESSOR OPERATOR

Communitization Agreement Numbers are listed on attached Exhibit "A"

Designation of successor Operator for communitized area, Counties of Uintah and
Duchesne, State of Utah, being:

(See attached Exhibit "A" for description of CommunitizationAgreements)

THIS INDENTURE, dated as of the 9th day of April, 1996, by and between
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation, hereinafter designated as "First Party", and the owners
of communitized working interests, hereinafter designated as "Second Parties",

WHEREAS, under the provisions of the Act of February 25, 1920, 41 Stat. 437,
30 U.S.C. Secs. 181, et seq., as amended by the Act of August 8, 1946, 60 Stat. 950, a
Communitization Agreement for the above Communitized Area, effective (see attached
Exhibit "A") wherein ANR Production Company is designated as Operator of the
communitized area; and

WHEREAS said, ANR Production Company has resigned as Operator, and the
designation of successor operator is now required pursuant to the terms thereon; and

WHEREAS the First Party has been and hereby is designated by Second Parties as
Operator of the communitized area, and said First Party desires to assume all the rights,
duties and obligations of Operator under the said CommunitizationAgreement.

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the premises hereinbefore set forth and
the promises hereinafter stated, the First Party hereby covenants and agrees to fulfill the
duties and assume the obligations of Operator of the communitized area under and pursuant
to all the terms of said CommunitizationAgreement, and the Second Parties covenants and
agree that, effective upon approval of this indenture by the Chief,Branch of Fluid Minerals,
Bureau of Land Management, First Party shall be granted the exclusive right and privilege
of exercising any and all rights and privileges as Operator, pursuant to the terms and
conditions of said Communitization Agreement; and said Agreement being hereby
incorporatedhereinby referenced and made a part hereof as fullyand effectively as though
said Agreement were expressly set forth in this instrument.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have executed this instrument as of the
date hereinabove set forth.

FIRST PARTY
COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION

Y
C. E. Lindberg
Vice
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STATE OF COLORADO )

COUNTY OF o )

. The foregoing instrument was acknowledged beforeme on the 9th day of April, 1996
by C. E. Lindberg, known to me to be the vice President of Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation,
a Delaware corporation, on behalf of said corporation.

Given under my hand and ofEcial seal of ofEce on this 9th day of April, 1996.

Notary Public in and for the State of Colorado
My Commission Expires:

1314 W. Shepperd Ave., #2038Littleton, Colorado 80120

The Designation of Successor Operator is hereby approved this 16th day of August, 1996, for the
Communitization Agreements listed on the attached sheet as Exhibit "A".

Actmg Superintendent
BIA - Uintah & Ouray



EXHIBIT "A" Page 1

Communitízation Agreement
Effective

Well Name Well Location County State Number Description Acres Date
Evans Ute 2-17B3 NWSW, 17-2S-3W Duchesne Utah 96104 (AllSec. 17-T2S-R3W 640.00 10/01/73
Miles 1-35A4 SWNE, 35-1S-4W Duchesne Utah 9618 All Sec. 35-T1S-R4W 640.00 0Ì/01770
Miles 2-35A4 NWSW, 35-1S-4W Duchesne Utah 9618 All Sec. 35-T1S-R4W 640.00 07/01/70
Brotherson 2-11B4 SESW, 11-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9623 All Sec. 11-T2S-R4W 640.00 09/01ÏŽO
Brotherson 2-2B4 NESW, 2-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9635 All Sec. 2-T2S-R4W 684.24 03/29/71
Brotherson 1-2B4 SWNE, 2-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9635 All Sec. 2-T2S-R4W 684.24 03/29/71
Broadhead 1-21B6 NWNE, 21-2S-6W Duchesne Utah 9639 All Sec. 21-T2S-R6W 640.00 10/21/71
Ute Tribal 2-21B6 SESE, 21-2S-6W Duchesne Utah 9639 Sec. 21-T2S-R6W 640.00 10/21/71

O Ute 1-34A4 SWNE, 34-1S-4W Duchesne Utah 9640 All Sec. 34-T1S-R4W 640.00 09/03/71
Ute Brotherson 2-34A4 NWSW, 34-1S-4W Duchesne Utah 9640 All Sec. 34-T1S-R4W 640.00 09/03/71
Rust 2-36A4 NESW, 36-1S-4W Duchesne Utah 9642 All Sec. 36-T1S-R4W 640.00 12/08/71
Ute 1-36A4 NENE, 36-1S-4W Duchesne Utah 9642 All Sec. 36-T1S-R4W 640.00 12/08/72
Babcock 1-12B4 SENE, 12-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9643 All Sec. 12-T2S-R4W 640.00 02/22/72
Babcock 2-12B4 SWSW, 12-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9643 All Sec. 12-T2S-R4W 640.00 02/22/72
Ellsworth 2-9B4 NESW, 9-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9645 AIISec. 9-T2S-R4W 640.00 03/27/72
Ellsworth 1-9B4 SENE, 9-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9645 All Sec. 9-T2S-R4W 640.00 03/27/72
Burton 2-1585 NWSW, 15-2S-5W Duchesne Utah 9646 All Sec. 15-T2S-R5W 640.00 0Šl30ÏÌž
Ute 1-1B4 SENE, 1-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9649 All Sec. 1-T2S-R4W 688.00 05/15/72
Ute Jenks 2-1B4 NENW, 1-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9649 All Sec. 1-T2S-R4W 688,00 05/15/72
Tew 2-10BS SWSW, 10-2S-5W Duchesne Utah 9654 All Sec. 10-T2S-RSW 640.00 09/26/72
Goodrich 1-2B3 NWSE, 2-2S-3W Duchesne Utah 9655 All Sec. 2-T2S-R3W 645.84 09/15/72
Goodrich 2-2B3 NENW, 2-2S-3W Duchesne Utah 9655 All Sec. 2-T2S-R3W 645.84 09/15/72
Robb 2-29B5 SESW, 29-2S-5W Duchesne Utah 9656 All Sec. 29-T2S-R5W 640.00 10/01/72
Ellsworth 1-16B4 NENE, 16-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9659 All Sec. 16-T2S-R4W 640.00 10/04/72
Ellsworth 2-16B4 NWSW, 16-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9659 All Sec. 16-T2S-R4W 640.00 10/04/72
Lake Fork 2-13B4 SWSW, 13-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9660 AllSec. 13-T2S-R4W 640.00 10/26/72
,Jessen 2-21A4 SESW, 21-1S-4W Duchesne Utah 9661 AllSec. 21-T1S-R4W 640.00 09/01/72
Jenkins 2-1B3 SWSW, 1-2S-3W Duchesne Utah 9670 All Sec. 1-T2S-R3W 644.92 11/30/72
Jenkins 1-1B3 SENW, 1-2S-3W Duchesne Utah 9670 All Sec. 1-T2S-R3W 644.92 11/30/72
Birch 3-27BS SWSW, 27-2S-5W Duchesne Utah 9671 All Sec. 27-T2S-RSW 640.00 01/30/73
Lazy K 2-11B3 NWNE, 11-2S-3W Duchesne Utah 9672 All Sec. 11-T2S-R3W 640.00 01/30/73
Rudy 1-11B3 NWSE, 11-2S-3W Duchesne Utah 9672 All Sec. 11-T2S-R3W 640.00 01/30/73
Brotherson 1-24B4 SWNE, 24-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9674 All Sec. 24-T2S-R4W 640.00 03/13/73
Evans 2-19B3 NESW, 19-2S-3W Duchesne Utah 9678 All Sec. 19-T2S-R3W 632.66 01/22/73
Evans 1-19B3 NENE, 19-2S-3W Duchesne Utah 9678 All Sec. 19-T2S-R3W 632.66 01/22/73

.
Ute 3-12B3 SWNW, 12-2S-3W Duchesne Utah 9679 All Sec. 12-T2S-R3W 640.00



EXHIBIT "A" Page 2

Communitization Agreement
EffectiveWell Name Well Locatíon County State Number Description Acres DateJenkins 2-1283 SENE, 12-2S-3W Duchesne Utah 9679 All Sec. 12-T2S-R3W 640.00 04/16/73Bleazard 2-2884 NESW, 28-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9681 All Sec. 28-T2S-R4W 640.00 03/15/73Ute 1-28B4 SWNE, 28-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9681 All Sec. 28-T2S-R4W 640.00 ÖŠl15/75Murdock 2-3485 NESW, 34-2S-5W Duchesne Utah _ 9685 All Sec. 34-T2S-RSW 640.00 02/12/73Ute Tribal 10-13A4 NWNE, 13-1S-4W Duchesne Utah 9C-126 All Sec. 13-T1S-R4W 640.00 03/10/74C.R. Aimes 1-23A4 SENE, 23-1S-4W Duchesne Utah 9C133 All Sec. 23-T1S-R4W 640.00 03/01/74Ute 1-8A1E SWNE, 8-1S-1E Uintah Utah 9C138 All Sec. 8-T1S-R1E 640.00 10/21/74Ute 2-33Z2 SWSW, 33-1N-2W Duchesne Utah 9C140 All Sec. 33-T1N-R2W 640.00 08/01/75ÜiiÏÑEniTSŠŽf¯

SWNE, 33-1N-2W Duchesne Utah 9C140 All Sec. 33-T1N-R2W 640.00 08/01/75Ute Smith 1-30B5 NESE, 30-2S-5W Duchesne Utah UTO80l4987C696 All Sec. 30-T2S-RSW 609.24 06/18/81Myrin Ranch 2-1883 NWSW, 18-2S-3W Duchesne Utah UTU70814 All Sec. 18-T2S-R3W 629.70 11/05/92Ute Tribal 2-22B6 SESE, 22-2S-6W Duchesne Utah UTU73743 Sec. 22-T2S-R6W 640.00 09/06/94Ute 1-1586 NWSW, 15-2S-6W Duchesne Utah UTU73964 All Sec. 15-T2S-T6W 640.00 04/11/95



(Iþ ill'Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
OPERATORCHANGEHORKSHEET "°" 2

y
1

Attach all documentation received by the division regarding this change. 2 ILE
Initial each listed item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable. 3

4
Change of Operator (well sold) O Designation of Agent 5

] Designation of operator O Operator Name Change Only 6 I

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed (EFFECTIVE DATE: 12-27-95

TO (new operator) COASTAL OIL & GAS CORP FROM (former operator) ANR PRODUCTION CO INC
(address) Po Box 749 (address) PD EDI 749

DENVER CO 80201-0749 DENVER CO 80iÕÏ-0749

phone (303 )572-1121 phone (303 )572-1121
account no. N 0230(B) account no. _NO675

Hel l (s) (attach addi tional page i f needed) :

Name:**SEE ATTACHED** API:(@~¾/ Entity: Sec Twp Rng Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec __Twp

_
Rng__ Lease Type:

Name: API: Entity: Sec _Twp __Rng___ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec___Twp Rng Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec___Twp Rng Lease T.ype:
Name: API: Entity: Sec___Twp _Rng Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec___Twp _Rng

__
Lease Type:

0 ERATO R('HANGEDOCUMEONTA

u dry or other l_egal documentation has been received from former
operator (Attach to this form).(b)/pg,g)

2. (Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or ther legal documentation has been received from new operator
(Attach to this form). / 34-f

6Áf 3. The Department of Commerce has been contacted if the new operator above is not currently
operating any wells in Utah. Is company registered with the state? (yes/no) If
yes, show company file number:

////â 4. (For Indian and Federal Hells ONLY) The BLM has been contacted regarding this change
(attach Telephone Documentation Form to this report). Make note of BLM status in
comments section of this form. Management review of Federal and Indian well operator
changes should take place prior to completion of steps 5 through 9 below.

§ 5. Changes have been tered in e Öil a d Gas nformati n ystem (Hang/IBM) for each well

6. Cardex file has been updated for each well listed above.

. Nell file labels have been updated for each well listed above.

8. Changes have been included on the monthly "Operator, Address, and Account Changes" memo
for distribution to State Lands and the Tax Commission. (g Lý )

9. A folder has been set up for the Operator Change file, and a copy of this page has been
placed there for reference during routing and processing of the original documents.

.. In mi

- OVER



IIb (Iþ
OPERATOR CHANGEWORKSHEET (CONTINUED) Initial each item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable.

ENTITY REVIeEHR615-8-7)

Entity assi ments have been reviewed for all wells listed above. Here
entity changes made? (yes/1 _ (If entity assignments were changed, attach copies of
Form 6, Entity Action FormT.

2. State Lands and the Tax Commission have been notified through normal procedures of
entity changes.

BO D VERIFICATION (Fee wells only) 644 No. //boS3gg-/ Ñ£7, //nÁÁÂ¿ÂcMÂ-

1. (Rule R615-3-1) The new operator of any fee lease well listed above has furnished a
proper bond.

2. A copy of this form has been placed in the new and former operators' bond files.

3. The former operator las requested release of liability from their bond (yes( g) ___.

Today's date /pa, //, 19 . If yes, div.ision response was made by letter

LEASE INTEREST OHNER NOTIFICATION RESPONSIBILITY

1. CRule R615-2-10) The former operator/1essee of any fee lease well listed above has been
notified by letter dated 19___, of their responsibility to notify any
person with an interest in such lease of the change of operator. Documentation of such
notification has been requested.

2. Copies of documents have been sent to State Lands for changes involving State leases.

FILMING ,

1. All attachments to this form have been microfilmed. Date: 1Ñ') .

FILING

1. Copies of all attachments to this form have been filed in each well file.

2. The oEiginal of this form and the original attachments have been filed in the Operator
Change file.

COMMENTS



CHANGE OF OPERATOR - From ANR Production Co. To Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 03/07/96 - Page 1 of 4

If Indian, LOCATIONCF WELL
Lease Designation Allottee or ¯

ŠecÜon,ÏownsÏiÏp
Well Name & No. API No. & Serial Number Tribe Name CA No. Footages & Range Field County

Evans Ute 2-17B3 43-013-31056 Fee Ute 96104 1701' FSL & 1474' FWL NWSW, 17-2S-3W Altamont DuchesneMiles 1-35A4 43-013-30029 Fee ( N/A 9618 1980' FNL& 1980' FEL SWNE, 35-1S-4W Altamont DuchesneMiles 2-35A4 43-013-31087 ( Fee N/A 9618 802' FWL & 1530' FSL NWSW, 35-1S-4W Altamont DuchesneBrotherson 2-11B4 43-013-31078 Fee 6 N/A 9623 944' FSL & 1643' FWL SESW, 11-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneBrotherson 1-2B4 43-013-30062 Fee 69 N/A 9635 1478' FNL & 1459' FEL SWNE, 2-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneBrotherson 2-2B4 43-013-30855 Fee QM N/A 9635 1371' FSL & 1498' FWL NESW, 2-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneBroadhead 1-21B6 43-013-30100 Patented 15 N/A 9639 540' FNL& 2610' FEL NWNE, 21-2S-6W Altamont DuchesneUte Brotherson 2-34A4 43-013-30978 Fee 00 70 N/A 9640 663' FWL& 1626' FSL NWSW, 34-1S-4W Altamont DuchesneRust 2-36A4 ¯¯
43-013-31092 Fee ( QU N/A 9642 1516' FWL& 1955' FSL NESW, 36-1S-4W Altamont DuchesneBabcock 1-12B4 43-013-30104

,
Patented 30 Ute 9643 .2248' FNL& 1000' FEL SENE, 12-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneBabcock 2-12B4 43-013-31005 | Fee ' [5 N/A 9643 502' FWL&503' FSL SWSW, 12-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneEllsworth 1-9B4 43-013-30118 i Patented /pp N/A 9645 1444' FNL& 700' FEL SENE, 9-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneEllsworth 2-9B4 43-013-31138 Fee IO//h N/A 9645 2976' FNL&2543' FWL NESW, 9-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneBurton 2-15B5 43-013-31044 Fee g|() N/A 9646 718' FWL& 1604' FSL NWSW, 15-2S-5W Altamont DuchesneTew 2-1085 43-013-31125 Fee jg N/A 9654 851' FWL& 729' FSL SWSW, 10-2S-5W Altamont DuchesneGoodrich 1-2B3 43-013-30182 Patented fr/ 6 N/A 9655 234T FSL & 1514' FEL NWSE, 2-2S-3W Bluebell DuchesneGoodrich 2-2B3 43-013-31246 Fee ||0 J N/A 9655 678' FNL &2235' FWL NENW, 2-2S-3W Bluebell DuchesneRobb 2-29B5 43-013-31130 Fee (0% N/A 9656 2214' FWL & 103T FSL SESW, 29-2S-5W Altamont DuchesneEllsworth 1-16B4 43-013-30192 Patented (73 Ute 9659 1301' FNL& 1101' FEL NENE, 16-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneEllsworth 2-16B4 43-013-31046 Fee N/A 9659 1075' FWL& 1439' FSL NWSW, 16-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne

- Lake Fork 2-13B4 43-013-31134 Fee N/A 9660 963' FWL& 819' FSL SWSW, 13-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneJessen 2-21A4 43-013-31256 Fee j /, j N/A 9661 702' FSL & 2182' FWL SESW, 21-1S-4W Altamont DuchesneJenkins 1-1B3 43-013-30175 Patented _ | ga N/A 9670 1807' FNL& 1888' FWL SENW, 1-2S-3W Bluebell DuchesneJenkins 2-1B3 43-013-31117 Fee j g N/A 9670 803' FWL& 662' FSL SWSW, 1-2S-3W Bluebell DuchesneBirch 3-27B5 43-013-31126 Fee j g N/A 9671 979' FWL & 1151' FSL SWSW, 27-2S-5W Altamont DuchesneLazy K2-11B3 43-013-31352 Fee || 2 N/A 9672 503' FNL&2017' FEL NWNE, 11-2S-3W Bluebell DuchesneRudy 1-11B3 43-013-30204 Patented jgg N/A 9672 2111' FSL &2483' FEL NWSE, 11-2S-3W Bluebell DuchesneBrotherson 1-24B4 43-013-30229 Fee | N/A 9674 1445' FNL& 1894' FEL SWNE, 24-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneBrotherson 3-23B4 43-013-31289 Fee | N/A 1177' FSL & 1112' FWL SWSW, 23-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneEvans 1-19B3 43-013-30265 Fee ( N/A 9678 1256' FNL&893' FEL NENE, 19-2S-3W Altamont DuchesneJenkins 2-12B3 43-013-31121 Fee jp N/A 9679 1623' FNL& 1047' FEL SENE, 12-2S-3W Bluebell DuchesneBleazard 2-28B4 43-013-31304 ' Fee N/A 9681 1580' FSL &2335' FWL NESW, 28-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne
Lamicq 2-5B2 43-013-30784 Fee N/A 9683 1963' FWL& 803' FSL SESW, 5-2S-2W Bluebell Duchesne S nC.R. Aimes 1-23A4 43-013-30375 Fee Sti'75 Ute 9C133 704' FEL & 1515' FNL SENE, 23-1S-4W Altamont DuchesneChandler 1-5B4 43-013-30140 Grv //4/r Patented ((;¶(6 Ute NW580 2120' FNL & 1553' FEL SWNE, 5-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne
Chandler 2-5B4 43-013-31000 ' u Fee (ppg6 Ute NW580 466' FSL & 1180' FWL SWSW, 5-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneMonsen 2-27A3 43-013-31104 " Fee /7ff, N/A NW581 1801' FWL&2008' FSL NFSW, 27-1S-3W Altamont DuchesneMonsen 3-27A3 43-013-31401 o Fee |¡',¶(/, N/A NW581 850' FNL & 1520' FWL NENW, 27-1S-3W Altamont DuchesneUte Smith 1-3085 43-013-30521 Fee So Ute UTO80l4987C696 1890' FSL &624' FEL NESE, 30-2S-5W Altamont DuchesneBleazard 1-18B4 43-013-30059 Patented j5/76 N/A N/A 1923' FNL& 2314' FEL SWNE, 18-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneBleazard 2-18B4 43-013-31025 Fee 15| N/A N/A 857' FWL& 861' FSL SWSW, 18-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneBodero 1-15B3 43-013-30565 Fee ÀZ/;0 N/A N/A 1370' FNL& 1679' FWL SENW, 15-2S-3W Altamont DuchesneBroadhead 2-32B5 43-013-31036 Fee /0 2//o N/A N/A 1686' FWL& 1116' FSL SESW, 32-2S-5W Altamont DuchesneBrotherson 1-10B4 43-013-30110 Patented _jl; N/A N/A 203T FNL &2052' FEL SWNE, 10-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneBrotherson 1-14Ñ 43-013-30051 Patented 1625 N/A N/A 2100' FNL&750' FEL SENE, 14-25-4W Altamont DuchesneBrotherson 1-22B4 43-013-30227 Fee O N/A N/A 1642' FNL& 129T FEL SENE, 22-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneBrotherson 1-23B4R 43-013-30483 Paterited N/A N/A 74T FNL &2380' FEL NWNE, 23-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneBrotherson 1-26B4 43-013-30336 Patented N/A N/A 1272' FNL& 1408' FEL NWNE,26-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneBrotherson 1-28A4 43-013-30292 Patented N/A N/A 751' FNL& 1130' FEL NENE, 28-1S-4W Altamont



O O
STATEOFUTAH FORM9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
OlVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

li INDIAN.ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON VVELLS

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for p<oposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen exisling wells below cu<rent bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

dril1horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposats.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER

Exhibit "A"
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMDER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

A Sonth 1200 East cny Vernal STATEUtahzie84078 435-789-4433
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

n. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submilin Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPA1R

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Dale of work completion:

COMMINGLE PRODUCtNG FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER: Name Change
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

As a result of the merger between The Coastal Corporation and a wholly owned

subsidary of El Paso Energy Corporation, the name of Coastal. Oil & Gas Corporation

has been changed to El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company effective March 9, 2001.

See Exhibit "A"

Bond # l+00JUO708
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

NAME(PLEASEPRINT Ohn T r TITLE Ÿice PreSident

SIGNATURE DATE 'O

El Paso duction Oil
T¯G

NAME(PLEASEPRif ) JOhn T z er TITLE Vice PreSident

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for ate use only

JUN19 2001
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND



Stateofl>elanzare

Office of the Secretary of State
PAGE 1

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF

DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATTACHED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT

COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF EMENDMENT OF "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION", CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION" TO "EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY", FILED IN

THIS OFFICE ON THE NINTH DAY OF MARCH, A.D. 2001, AT 11 O'CLOCK

A.M.

RECEî VED

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND MINING

Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary of State

0610204 8100 AUTEENTICATION: 1061007

010162788 DATE:



O O
03/09/01 10:14 FAX 713 420 4099 CORP. LAW DEPT. 003/003

CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT

OF

CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION (the "Company"), a corporationorganized and existing under and by virtue of the General Corporation Law of the State ofDelaware, DOES HEREBY CERTTFY:

FIRST: That the Board of Directors of the Company, by the unanimouswritten consent of its members, filed with the minutes of the Board, adopted a resolutionproposing and declaring advisable the fonowing amendment to the Certißcate ofIncorporation of the Company:

RESOLVED that it is deemed advisable that the Certificate ofIncorporation of this Company be amended, and that said Certificate ofIncorporation be so amended, by changing the Article thereof numbered"FIRST." so that,as amended, said Article shall be and read as follows:

"FIRST. The name of the corporation is El Paso Production Oil & Gas
Company."

SECOND: That in lieu of a meeting and vote of stockholders, thestockholders entitled to vote have given unanimous written consent to said amendment inaccordance with the provisions of Section 228 of the General Coyoration Law of theState of Delaware.

THIRD: That the aforesaid amendment was duly adopted in accordance withthe applicable provisions of Sections 242 and 228 of the General Corporation Law of theState of Delaware.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, said COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATIONhas caused this certincate to be signed on its behalf by a Vice Presidentand attested by anAssistant Secætary, this 9th dayof March 2001.

COASTALOIL& GAS CORPORATION

DavidL. siddall
Vice President

Attest:

STATE OF DELAWARE
SECRETARY OF STATE

E , DIVISION OF CORPORATIONSM et E. Roark, sista t Secretmy R CE IVE mioitar :::a°°

JUN19 2001
DIVISIONOF

OIL, GAS AND



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH 4-KAS e/
2. CDWV 5-LPt/
3. JLT 6-FILE

Enter date after each listed item is completed

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent

Operator Name Change (Only) X Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 3-09-2001

FROM: (oldoperator): TO: ( New Operator):
COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY
Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 RM 2975B

HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995 HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995
Phone: 1-(713)-418-4635 Phone: 1-(832)-676-4721
Account NO230 Account N1845

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)

API ENTITY SEC TWN LEASE WELL WELL
NAME NO NO RNG TYPE TYPE STATUS
BABCOCK 2-12B4 (CA 96-43) 43-013-31005 10215 12-02S-04W FEE OW P
MYRIN RANCH 1-13B4 (CA 96-60) 43-013-30180 1775 13-02S-04W FEE OW S
T,AKEFORK 2-1384 (CA 96-60) 43-013-31134 10452 13-02S-04W FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 1-14B4 43-013-30051 1535 14-02S-04W FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 2-14B4 43-013-30815 10450 14-02S-04W FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 2-15B4 43-013-31103 1771 15-02S-04W FEE OW P
LAKE FORK 3-15B4 43-013-31358 11378 15-02S-04W FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 1-16B4 (CA 96-59) 43-013-30192 1735 16-02S-04W FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-16B4 (CA 96-59) 43-013-31046 10217 16-02S-04W FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 1-17B4 43-013-30126 1695 17-02S-04W FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-17B4 43-013-31089 1696 17-02S-04W FEE OW P
BLEAZARD 1-18B4 43-013-30059 1565 18-02S-04W FEE OW S
BLEAZARD 2-18B4 43-013-31025 1566 18-02S-04W FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 1-19B4 43-013-30183 1760 19-02S-04W FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-19B4 43-013-31105 1761 19-02S-04W FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 1-20B4 43-013-30351 1900 20-02S-04W FEE OW S
ELLSWORTH 2-20B4 43-013-31090 1902 20-02S-04W FEE OW S
ELLSWORTH 3-20B4 43-013-31389 11488 20-02S-04W FEE OW P
HUNT 1-21B4 43-013-30214 1840 21-02S-04W FEE OW P
HUNT 2-21B4 43-013-31114 1839 21-02S-04W FEE OW S
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 06/19/2001

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 06/19/2001
3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 06/21/2001

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number:



O O
5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on: N/A

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: N/A

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator
for wells listed on: N/A

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,

for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 07/05/2001

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 07/05/2001

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 06/20/2001

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 07/05/2001

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed has furnished a bond: 400JUO708

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE

FILMING:
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on:

FILING:
1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:

COMMENTS: Master list of all wells involved in operator change from Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation to El Paso
Production Oil and Gas Company shall be retained in the "Operator Change



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

FEE
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for pmposals io drillnewwells,significantlydeepen existingwells below cunent bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal ialerals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMFTTO DRILLfonn for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Lake Fork 2-13B4

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EL PASO E&P COMPANY, L.P. 4301331134
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1099 18TH ST, STE 1900 DENVER STATE CO zi,80202 (303) 291-6400 ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 963' FWL, 819' FSL COUNTY: DUCHESNE

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SWSW 13 2S 4W STATE:
UTAH

n. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ^CIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Appm dele work wil d CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

3/1/2007 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL

(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date ofwork completion:
O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearlyshow all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

OPERATOR REQUESTS APPROVAL TO SQUEEZE OLD PERFS, ADD INFILLPERFS AND ACIDIZE OPEN PERFS IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE ATTACHED PROCEDURES.

NAME(PLEASE PR JENNIFER T BECHTEL TITLE ASSOCIATE A YST

SIGNATURF DATE 2/12/2007

(Thisepace useonly) v UF RECENED
IL, GAS AND MINING FEBi 32007

AT 2

(5/2000) ,
(See Instructions on Reverse Side) DN.OF0\L,GAS8eM\NIN



EL PASO PRODUCTION COMPANY

Recompletion Procedure
Lake Fork 2-13B4

To
Squeeze OffPerfs at 10,608' to 11,299', Add Infill Wasatch

Perfs and Acidize Open Peris

Section 13, T2S, R4W
Altamont-Blue Bell Field
Duchesne County, Utah

Procedure:

1. MIRU workover rig. Load wellwith TPW. POOH with rods and pump.

2. ND tree, NU and test BOP's. Release TA and POOH with tubingand BHA.

3. RU EL and run gauge ring to 11,400'. POOH. RIH and set CBP at 11,320'. RIH and
set CICR at 10,580. RD EL.

4. RIH with stingerand tubingand sting into CICR.

5. RU cementers. Test surface lines to 8,500 psi. Establish break down rate. Mix and
pump 200 sacks Low Fluid Loss Class G cement at 15.6 ppg followed by stage
squeeze of 50 sks Class G cement w/ retarder as needed at 16.0 ppg. (Cement
designs based on 202°F @ 11,100'.) Sting out of CICR. Pull 2 jts of tubing and
reverse tubingclean. TOOH. WOC.

6. PU RB and DC's and RIH to top of CICR. Drill out cement to top of CBP at 11,350'.
Test squeezes ever 200'. Re-squeeze as necessary. Drillout CBP and clean well to
PBD at 13,292' Circulate hole clean. POOH and LD BHA.

7. RU EL and perf Wasatch per attached perf sheet with 3-1/8" HSC guns loaded 3 spf,
120 deg phased w/ 22.7 gram premium charges. RD



8. TIH with 5" RTB and treating packer on 3,200' of 2 7/8" 6.5# N-80 FJ tubing on the
bottom of 3 1/2" 9.3 # N-80 workstring. Test tubingon TIH to 9,000 psi. Set RTB at
13,280' and treatingpacker @ 12,180'. Test annulus to 1500 psi.

9. Break down perfs wl 3% KCL at approximately 5 bpm. Monitor annulus for
communication. Report ISIP and leak-off in 5, 10 & 15 minute intervals.

10. MI&RUStimulation Company. Acidize Wasatch perfs at 12,218'-13,263' with 10,400
gals 15% HCL in two 5,200 gal stages @max rate utilizingBio-balls (Brown colored)
and rock salt for diversion. Heat treatingwater to 160° F. Maximumallowable surface
treatingpressure 8,500 psi. Monitor backside for pressure throughoutjob.

11. Allow well to flow back. Release treating packer and reverse circulate well clean. TIH
and retrieve RTB at 13,280. PU and set RTB at 12,170' and treating packer @
11,320'. Test annulus to 1500 psi.

12. MI&RU Stimulation Company. Break down perfs w/ 3% KCL at approximately 5 bpm.
Monitor annulus for communication. Report ISIP and leak-off in 5, 10 & 15 minute
intervals.

13. Acidize Wasatch perfs at 11,334'-12,101' with 8,500 gals 15% HCL in two 4,250 gal
stages @max rate utilizingBio-balls (Brown colored) and rock salt for diversion. Heat
treating water to 160° F. Maximum allowable surface treating pressure 8,500 psi.
Monitorbackside for pressure throughoutjob.

14. Attempt to flow back well. If well does not flow back, release packer, reverse hole
clean, TIH and retrieve RTB. POOH and LD workstring, packer and RTB.

15. RIH with 2-7/8" production tubingstring and tubinganchor. Set tubinganchor and SN
at appropriate design depths.

16. ND BOP & NUwellhead.

17. Run pump and rods. Space out, stroke test pump and hang off.

18. RD&MOworkover rig. Place well on production. Clean



OHL Holes OHL Holes OHL Holes OHL Holes OHL Holes OHL Holes

11,334-3& 6 11 720-20' 6 11,982' 3 12,304' 3 12,663' 3 12,939-41' 6
11,367-69' 6 11,726-28' 6 11,991' 3 12,310' 3 12,673' 3 12,944' 3
11,376-78' 6 11,733' 3 11,998-00' 6 12,313' 3 12,691' 3 12,950' 3
11,383-85' 6 11,735-37' 6 12,009' 3 12,337' 3 12,705' 3 12,968-70' 6
11,408-10' 6 11 743 05' 6 12,015' 3 12,343' 3 12 709-11' 6 12,985-8¯" 6
11,482-84' 6 11,757 3 12,029-31' 6 12,357 3 12,723' 3 12:,997 3

11,460' 3 11,667-69' 6 12,036' 3 12,367' 3 12,746' 3 13,015' 3

11,48T 3 11,829' 3 12,043-05' 6 12,387' 3 12,762' 3 13,091' 3

11,499' 3 11,834' 3 12,051' 3 12,410' 3 12,767-690 6 13,109-11' 6
11,506' 3 11,843' 3 12,056' 3 12,424' 3 12 784-85' 6 13,115-17 6

11,513' 3 11,849' 3 12,067 3 12,441' 3 12,801' 3 13,131' 3
11,515-17' 6 11,856-59' 9 12,077' 3 12,448' 3 12,80T 3 13,155-57' 6
11,523-25' 6 11,867-70' 9 12,081' 3 12,454' 3 12,813' 3 13,164-66' 6

11,535' 3 11,875' 3 12,095' 3 12,470' 3 12,817-19' 6 13,156' 3

11,538' 3 11,878' 3 12,101' 3 12,«‡94' 3 12,.834' 3 13,175' 3

11,545' 3 11,8B4-EMi' 6 12,201-03' 6 12,505' 3 12,&44' 3 13,192' 3

11,568' 3 11,896' 3 12,210' 3 12,512' 3 12,852' 3 13,209' 3

11,572' 3 11,903' 3 12,214' 3 12,521' 3 12,869' 3 13,217 3

11,578' 3 11,912' 3 12,218-20' 6 12,527 3 12,886' 3 13,223' 3

11,585-87" 6 11,923-25' 6 12,222' 3 12,529-:¾3' 12 12,889' 3 13,241' 3

11,600' 3 11,935-37 6 12,234' 3 12,541-42' 3 12,898' 3 13,250' 3
11,613-16' 9 11,951' 3 12,237-39' 6 12,550-52' 6 12,909' 3 13,263' 3

11,634' 3 11,969' 3 12,269-71' 6 12,570' 3 12,916' 3

11,709' 3 11,976' 3 12,276-78' 6 12,1542' 3 12,922' 3

Existing Original Perfs Proposed New Perfs Total Holes - 564 February 12,



Lake Fork 24384
PERFORATRmsCftDULE- WABATCN FORET10R

TABLE1
np.n swa nar..ema ey nrm.nr an.. rm inn tw..t m sa

OHL Holes OHL Holes OHL Holes OHL Holes OHL Holes OHL Holes

10,608-10' 6 11,297-99' 6 11,829' 3 12,201-03' 6 12,642' 3 13,091' 3

10,627-29' 6 11,334-36' 6 11,834' 3 12,210' 3 12,663' 3 13,109-11' 6
10,632-35' 9 11,367-69' 6 11,843' 3 12,214' 3 12,673' 3 13,115-17' 6

10,638-40' 6 11,376-78' 6 11,849' 3 12,218-20' 6 12,691' 3 13,131' 3

10,663-65' 6 11,383-85' 6 11,856-59' 9 12,222' 3 12,705' 3 13,155-57' 6
10,673-75' 6 11,408-10' 6 11,867-70' 9 12,234' 3 12,709-11' 6 13,164-66' 6

10,679-81' 6 11,482-84' 6 11,875' 3 12,237-39' 6 12,723' 3 13,156' 3

10,723-25' 6 11,483' 3 11,878' 3 12,269-71' 6 12,746' 3 13,175' 3

10,737-39' 6 11,487' 3 11,884-86' 6 12,276-78' 6 12,762' 3 13,192' 3

10,753-55' 6 11,499' 3 11,896' 3 12,304' 3 12,767-69' 6 13,209' 3

10,769-72' 9 11,506' 3 11,903' 3 12,310' 3 12,784-86' 6 13,217' 3
10,783-85' 6 11,513' 3 11,912' 3 12,313' 3 12,801' 3 13,223' 3

10,808-10' 6 11,515-17' 6 11,923-25' 6 12,337' 3 12,807' 3 13,241' 3

10,817-19' 6 11,523-25' 6 11,935-37 6 12,343' 3 12,813' 3 13,250' 3

10,831-33 6 11,535' 3 11,951' 3 12,357' 3 12,817-19' 6 13,263' 3

10,849-51' 6 11,538' 3 11,969' 3 12,367' 3 12,834' 3

10,855-56' 3 11,545' 3 11,976' 3 12,387' 3 12,844' 3

10,872-74' 6 11,568' 3 11,982' 3 12,410' 3 12,852' 3

10,889-91' 6 11,572' 3 11,991' 3 12,424' 3 12,869' 3

10,908-10' 6 11,578' 3 11,998-00' 6 12,441' 3 12,886' 3

10,922-24' 6 11,585-87' 6 12,009' 3 12,448' 3 12,889' 3

10,932-34' 6 11,600' 3 12,015' 3 12,454' 3 12,898' 3

10,940-42' 6 11,613-16' 9 12,029-31' 6 12,470' 3 12,909' 3

10,949-51' 6 11,634' 3 12,036' 3 12,494' 3 12,916' 3

11,038-40' 6 11,709' 3 12,043-45' 6 12,505' 3 12,922' 3

11,097-99' 6 11,720-20' 6 12,051' 3 12,512' 3 12,939-41' 6

11,124-26' 6 11,726-28' 6 12,056' 3 12,521' 3 12,944' 3

11,161-64' 9 11,733' 3 12,067' 3 12,527 3 12,950' 3

11,201-03' 6 11,735-37' 6 12,07T 3 12,529-33' 12 12,968-70' 6
11,223-25' 6 11,743-45' 6 12,081' 3 12,541-42' 3 12,985-87' 6

11,268-70' 6 11,75T 3 12,095' 3 12,550-52' 6 12,997' 3

11,278-80' 6 11,667-69' 6 12,101' 3 12,570' 3 13,015' 3

Original Perfs Proposed Perfs February 12,



O
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

FEE

SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITorCA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do not use thisform for proposals to drIllnewwells, signifloantlydeepen existingwells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells,orto

drillhorlzontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for suchproposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL -- 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

OILWELL / GAS WELL |__| OTHER LAKEFORK 2-13B4 R
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EL PASO E & P COMPANY,LP 4301331134
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1099 18TH ST., STE 1900 CITY DENVER STATE CO ZlP 80202 (303) 291-6400 ALTAMONT
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: FWL, 819' FSL COUNTY: DUCHESNE

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,MERIDIAN:(SN)3 (2S 4W [ STATE:
UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ^ci = O DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit In Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximate date work willsta t CASINGREPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: CANCELNOI
O CONVERTWELLTYPE O RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show allpertinent detalls Includingdates, depths, volumes, etc.

OPERATOR REQUESTS TO CANCELNOIAPPROVED 2/15/2007 TO SQZ PERFS, ADD PERFS ANDACIDIZEPERFS ON SUBJECT
WELL.

Acceptedby the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

For Record Only

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) SHANELLEDEATER TITLE ENGINEERINGTECH

SIGNATURE DATE 12/4/2008

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED

(6/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) DECO9 2003
DIV.0FOlL,GAS&



API Well No: 43013311340000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 LAKE FORK 2-13B4 R 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43013311340000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 1099 18th ST, STE 1900 , Denver, CO, 80202 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0819 FSL 0963 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWSW Section: 13 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

4/1/2010

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 EL PASO E & P COMPANY REQUESTS APPROVAL TO ADD INFILL WASATCH
PERFS ADN ACIDIZE OPEN PERFS ACCORDING TO THE ATTACHED

PROCEDURE.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Marie Okeefe

TITLE
 Sr Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 2/4/2010

PHONE NUMBER:
303 291-6417  Ext 

 

PHONE NUMBER
303 291-6417

February 10, 2010

iPI Well No: 43013311340000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EEEASEDESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well LAKE FORK 2-13B4 R

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
ELPASOE&PCOMPANY,LP 43013311340000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1099 18th ST, STE 1900 , Denver, CO, 80202 303 291-6417 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

0819 FSL 0963 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: SWSW Section: 13 Township: 02.05 Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

4/1/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EL PASO E & P COMPANY REQUESTS APPROVAL TO ADD INFILL WASATCH
PERFS ADN ACIDIZE OPEN PERFS ACCORDING TO THE ATTACHED Approved by the

PROCEDURE. Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: Fe au 2010

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Marie Okeefe 303 291-6417 Sr Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A
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EL PASO PRODUCTION COMPANY

Recompletion Procedure
Lake Fork 2-13B4

To
Add Infi/IWasatch Perfs and Acidize Open Perfs

Section 13, T2S, R4W
Altamont-Blue Bell Field
Duchesne County, Utah

Prepared by:
Doug Sprague Date 2

Approved by:
Mike Vennes Date

Distribution(Approved copies):
Doug Sprague
Mike Vennes
Well File (Central Records)
Altamont Office (Well
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Recompletion Procedure
Lake Fork 2-13B4

Section 13, T2S, R4W
Altamont-Bluebell Field
Duchesne County, Utah

COMPANY PERSONNEL

Title Name Office Mobile Home

Production Manager Mike Vennes (303) 291-6440 (720) 545-7280

Production Engineer Doug Sprague (303) 291-6433 (303) 957-6176 (303) 627-4970

Production Foreman Gary Lamb (435) 454-4224 (435) 823-1443 (435) 454-3537

TUBULARDATA
Material Description Burst Col Body Jt ID Drift Cap TOC

(100%) (100%) Yield Yield ID Bbis/ft o
Surface 9-5/8" 36# J-55 @ 5,000' 3950 2570 630 520 8.835 8.599 .0758 SURF Ë
Casing
Intermediate 7" 26# N-80/P-110 @ 7240 5410 604 519 6.276 6.151 .0383 8,800'
Casing 10,400' (CBL)

Production 5" 18# P-110 @ 10,186'- 13940 13470 580 495 4.276 4.151 .0178 10,766'
Liner 13,294' (TOL)
Production 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 EUE 10570 11160 2.441 2.347 .00579

Tubing

Procedure:

1. MIRUworkover rig. Load well with TPW. POOH with rods and pump.

2. ND tree, NUand test BOP's. Release TA and POOH with tubingand BHA.

3. RIH with 5" RTB and 7" packer. Set RTB at 10,590' and test casing. If casing
doesn't test, isolate leak and squeeze as necessary. Recover RTB.

4. RU EL and perf Wasatch per attached perf sheet with 3-1/8" HSC guns loaded
3 spf, 120 deg phased w/ 22.7 gram premium charges. RD EL.

5. TIH with 5" treating packer on 1,300' of 2 7/8" 6.5# N-80 FJ tubing on the
bottom of 3 1/2" 9.3 # N-80 workstring. Test tubingon TIH to 9,000 psi. Set
treatingpacker @
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6. Ml&RU Stimulation Company. Acidize Wasatch perfs at 11,334'-13,263' with
15,000 gals 15% HCL in five 3,000 gal stages @ maximum rate for tubulars
utilizing Bio-balls (Brown or green) and rock salt for diversion. All fluids to
contain 2% KCIsubstitute, scale inhibitor, biocide, and 2.0 gpt MA-844 provided
by treating company. Heat treating water to 160° F. Maximum allowable
surface treating pressure 8,500 psi. Monitor backside for pressure
throughoutjob.

7. Allow well to flow back. Release treating packer and reverse circulate well
clean. POOH.

8. RIH with 2-7/8" production tubingstring and tubinganchor. Set tubinganchor
and SN at appropriatedesign depths.

9. ND BOP & NU wellhead.

10. Run pump and rods. Space out, stroke test pump and hang off.

11. RD&MOworkover rig. Place wellon production. Clean



February 04, 2010

Lake Fork 2-1384
PERFORATIONÀCHEDULE- WASATCH FORMATION

TABLE1
Open Hole Reference Log: Dresser Atlas DIFLI GR Dated 1/12M6

OHL Holes OHL Holes OHL Holes OHL Holes OHL Holes OHL Holes
10,608-10' 6 11,297-99' 6 11,829' 3 12,201-03' 6 12,642' 3 13,091' 3
10,627-29' 6 11,334-36' 6 11,834' 3 12,210' 3 12,663' 3 13,109-11 6
10,632-35' 9 11.367-69' 6 11,843" 3 12,214' 3 12,673' 3 13,115-17' 6
10,638-40' 6 11,376-78' 6 11,849' 3 12,218-20' 6 12,6916 3 13,131' 3
10,663-65' 6 11,383-85' 6 11,856-59' 9 12.222' 3 12,705' 3 13,155-57 6
10,673-75' 6 11,408-10' 6 11,867-70' 9 12,234' 3 12,709-11' 6 13,164-66' 6
10,679-81' 6 11,482-84' 6 11,875' 3 12,237-39' 6 12,723' 3 13,156' 3
10,723-25' 6 11,483' 3 11,878' 3 12,269-71' 6 12,746' 3 13,175' 3
10.737•39' 6 11,467' 3 11,884-66' 6 12,276-78' 6 12,762' 3 13,192' 3
10,753-55' 6 11,499' 3 11,896' 3 12,304' 3 12,767-69° 6 13,209' 3
10,769-72' 9 11,506' 3 11,903 3 12,310' 3 12.784-86' 6 13,217 3
10,783-85' 6 11,513' 3 11,912 3 12,313' 3 12,801' 3 13,223' 3
10,808-10' 6 11,515-17' 6 11,923·25' 6 12,337' 3 12,807' 3 13,241' 3
10,817-19' 6 11,523-25' 6 11,935-3T 6 12,343' 3 12,813' 3 13,250' 3

10,831-33 6 11,535' 3 11,951 3 12,357' 3 12,817-19" 6 13,263' 3
10,849-51' 6 11,530' 3 11,969' 3 12,36T 3 12,834' 3
10.855-56' 3 11,545' 3 11,976 3 12,387' 3 12,844' 3
10,872-74' 6 11,568° 3 11 982 3 12,410' 3 12,852' 3
10,889-91' 6 11,572' 3 11,99T 3 12,424° 3 12,869' 3
10,908-10' 6 11,578' 3 11,998-00' 6 12,441' 3 12,886' 3
10.922-24' 6 11,585-8T 6 12.009' 3 12,448' 3 12,889' 3
10,932-34' 6 11,600' 3 12,015 3 12,454' 3 12,898' 3
10,940-42' 6 11,613-16' 9 12,029-31' 6 12,470' 3 12,909' 3
10,949-51' 6 11,634' 3 12,036' 3 12,494' 3 12,916' 3
11,038-40' 6 11,709' 3 12,043-45' 6 12,505' 3 12,922' 3
11,097-996 6 11,720-20' 6 12,051° 3 12,512' 3 12,939-41' 6
11,124-26' 6 11,726-28' 6 12,056' 3 12,521' 3 12,944' 3
11,161-64' 9 11,733· 3 12,06T 3 12,527' 3 12,950' 3
11,201-03' 6 11,735-37' 6 12,077 3 12.529-33' 12 12,968-70' 6
11,223-25' 6 11,743-45' 6 12,081' 3 12.541-42' 3 12,985-87' 6
11,268-70' 6 11,75T 3 12.095' 3 12,550-52' 6 12,99T 3
11,278-80' 6 11,667-69' 6 12,101' 3 12,570' 3 13,015' 3

Original Perfs Proposed Perfs February 9, 2010

RECEIVED February 04,



API Well No: 43013311340000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 LAKE FORK 2-13B4 R 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43013311340000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 1099 18th ST, STE 1900 , Denver, CO, 80202 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0819 FSL 0963 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWSW Section: 13 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

3/31/2010

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 EL PASO E & P COMPANY IS ON THE SUBJECT WELL THAT WAS APPROVED
TO PERFORATE INFILL WASATCH ZONE. WE CURRENTLY HAVE A FISH AT
11,650'AND PLAN TO PLUG BACK WITH A CIBP @ 10,580'. WE PLAN TO

PERFORATE 8931' - 10564' TO COMPLETE IN THE LOWER GREEN RIVER. EL
PASO REQUESTS APPROVAL TO PLUG BACK TO LOWER GREEN RIVER. FISH
MAY CONSIST OF A 2-7/8" PUP JOINT AND A FAILED PACKER. WE MADE

SEVERAL ATTEMPTS TO RECOVER THE FISH BUT ONLY RETRIEVED SMALL
PIECES OF METAL. WE HAVE NO REASON TO BELIEVE THAT THE FISH

CONTAINS A RADIOACTIVE SOURCE. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Marie Okeefe

TITLE
 Sr Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 3/30/2010

PHONE NUMBER:
303 291-6417  Ext 

 

PHONE NUMBER
303 291-6417

March 31, 2010

iPI Well No: 43013311340000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EEEASEDESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well LAKE FORK 2-13B4 R

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
ELPASOE&PCOMPANY,LP 43013311340000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1099 18th ST, STE 1900 , Denver, CO, 80202 303 291-6417 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

0819 FSL 0963 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; SWSW Section: 13 Township: 02.05 Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

3/31/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EL PASO E & P COMPANY IS ON THE SUBJECT WELL THAT WAS APPROVED
TO PERFORATE INFILL WASATCH ZONE. WE CURRENTLY HAVE A FISH AT Approved by the

11,650'AND PLAN TO PLUG BACK WITH A CIBP @ 10,580'. WE PLAN TO Utah Division of
PERFORATE 8931' - 10564' TO COMPLETE IN THE LOWER GREEN RIVER. EL Oil, Gas and Mining
PASO REQUESTS APPROVAL TO PLUG BACK TO LOWER GREEN RIVER. FISH

MAYCONSIST OF A 2-7/8" PUP JOINT AND A FAILED PACKER. WE MADE Date: Ma ch 31(2910
,

SEVERAL ATTEMPTS TO RECOVER THE FISH BUT ONLY RETRIEVED SMALL
PIECES OF METAL. WE HAVE NO REASON TO BELIEVE THAT THE FISH By:

CONTAINS A RADIOACTIVE SOURCE.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Marie Okeefe 303 291-6417 Sr Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



API Well No: 43013311340000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 LAKE FORK 2-13B4 R 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43013311340000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 1099 18th ST, STE 1900 , Denver, CO, 80202 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0819 FSL 0963 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWSW Section: 13 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

4/14/2010

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 EL PASO E & P COMPANY RECOMPLETED THE SUBJECT WELL ACCORDING TO
THE ATTACHED REPORT.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Marie Okeefe

TITLE
 Sr Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 5/28/2010

PHONE NUMBER:
303 291-6417  Ext 

 

PHONE NUMBER
303 291-6417

May 28, 2010

June 01, 2010

iPI Well No: 43013311340000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EEEASEDESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well LAKE FORK 2-13B4 R

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
ELPASOE&PCOMPANY,LP 43013311340000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1099 18th ST, STE 1900 , Denver, CO, 80202 303 291-6417 Ext ALTAMONT

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

0819 FSL 0963 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; SWSW Section: 13 Township: 02.05 Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOpReTtion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

4/14/2010 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

O DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EL PASO E & P COMPANY RECOMPLETED THE SUBJECT WELL ACCORDING TO
THE ATTACHED REPORT. Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECRgg2gNLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Marie Okeefe 303 291-6417 Sr Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/28/2010

RECEIVED May 28,



May 28, 2010

EL PASO PRODUCTION Page 1 of 5

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: LAKE FORK 2-13B4
Common Well Name: LAKE FORK 2-13B4 Spud Date: 11/14/1985
Event Name: RECOMPLETION Start: 3/16/2010 End: 4/14/2010
Contractor Name: BASIC ENERGY SERVICES Rig Release: 4/14/2010 Group:
Rig Name: BASIC Rig Number:. 1584

Date From - To Hours Code Phase Description of Operations

3/17/2010 12:00 - 14:30 2.50 C 01 MOVE RIG TO LOCATION & RU.
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 C 01 LOCK OUT PUMPING UNIT. LD HORSE HEAD. WORK PUMP OFF

SEAT.
15:00 - 16:00 1.00 C 08 FLUSH TBG W/ 60 BBLS TPW.
16:00 - 18:30 2.50 C TOOH WI 118 1" RODS & 48 7/8" RODS. PU POLISH ROD. SDFN

3/18/2010 07:00 - 07:30 0.50 C 18 HOLD SAFETY MEETING & START RIG
07:30 -10:30 3.00 C 04 TOOH WI RODS & PUMP, FLUSHING AS NEEDED & REMOVING

BROKEN ROD GUIDES FROM PUMP TEE.
10:30-11:00 0.50 C 10 NDWELLHEAD
11:00-12:00 1.00 C 15 RELEASE TAC. NU BOP
12:00 -16:00 4.00 C 04 TOOH W/ PRODUCTION TBG ASSEMBLY. LD PBGA & MUD JT
16:00 -19:00 3.00 C TALLY & PU 5" PLUG & PKR, 1 JT 2-3/8"EUE TBG, SEAT NIPPLE, 15

JTS 2-3/8"EUE TBG, X-OVER, & 118 JTS 2-7/8" TBG. SDFN
3/19/2010 07:00 -07:30 0.50 C 18 HOLD SAFETY MEETING, START RIG & INSPECT BRAKES

07:30 - 10:30 3.00 C 04 CONTINUE TIH WI PLUG, PKR & TBG. SET PLUG @ 10551'. SET
PKR @ 10555'.

10:30 - 12:30 2.00 C 09 PUMP 56 BBLS TPW DOWN TBG. PRESSURED UP TO 600 PSI,
THEN DROPPED TO O PSI. CHECK RBP. RBP STILL SET. RESET
PKR @ 10855'. FILLTBG Wl45 BBLS TPW. PRESSURED UP TO
1000 PSI, THEN DROPPED TO 0 PSI. RELEASE PKR. RETRIEVE
RBP. MOVE UPHOLE. SET RBP @ 10456'. SET PKR @ 10501'. FILL
TBG Wl43 BBLS TPW.PRESSURE UP TO 1000 PSI THEN DROPPED
TO O PSI. FILLCSG Wl217 BBLS TPW. PRESSURE TEST CSG TO
1000 PSI, FOR 30 MINUTES. TESTED GOOD

12:30 - 16:00 3.50 C 04 TOOH WI TBG & TOOLS. PREPARE TO PERFORATE. SDFN
3/20/2010 07:00 - 07:30 0.50 C 18 HOLD SAFETY MEETING. START RIG & SAFETY CHECK BRAKES

07:30 - 10:30 3.00 C 11 RU LONE WOLF WIRELINE UNIT. RIH W/ RUN 1 OF 5 3-1/8" OD
PERF GUNS. SET DOWN & 11161'. PU ON GUN. GUN STUCK.
WORK GUN FREE. POOH W/ PERF GUN. RD WIRELINE TRUCK.

10:30 - 12:00 1.50 C 18 UNLOAD 3-1/2" TBG WHILE WAITING ON DRILLCOLLARS
12:00 - 15:00 3.00 C 04 MEASURE & PU 4-1/8"OD MILL,BIT SUB, 4 3-1/8"OD DRILL

COLLARS, X-OVER & 94 JTS 2-3/8"EUE TBG. RAN IN & LD 16 JTS
2-3/8"EUE TBG OUT OF DERRICK.PREPARE TO HYDROTEST 2-7/8"
TBG. SDFN

3/21/2010 07:00 -07:30 0.50 C 18 HOLD SAFETY MEETING, START RIG & SAFET CHECK BRAKES
07:30 - 17:00 9.50 C 04 TIH W/ 265 JTS 2-7/8" PRODUCTION TBG, HYDRO TESTING TBG

TO 8500 PSI. TAGGED UP @ 12036'. LD 48 JTS TBG. HYDROTEST
IN HOLE W/ 48 JTS 2-7/8" PRODUCTION TBG OUT OF DERRICK. RD
HYDROTEST UNIT. TOOH W/ 58 JTS 2-7/8" TBG. SDFN

3/22/2010 07:00 -07:30 0.50 C 18 HOLD SAFETY MEETING. START RIG & CHECK DRAW WORKS
BRAKES

07:30 -09:00 1.50 C 04 TIH W/ 48 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. RU STRIPPER HEAD & POWER
SWIVEL

09:00 - 12:00 3.00 C 08 RU HEAT WAVES PUMP TRUCK & RIG PUMP. PUMP 1576 BBLS
TPW DOWN CSG @10.5 BPM. DID NOT BREAK CIRCULATION.
ATTEMPT TO CLEAN OUT CSG.UNABLE TO MAKEANY HOLE

12:00 -13:00 1.00 C 04 RD POWER SWIVEL. TOOH W/ 44 JTS 2-7/8" TBG.
13:00 -16:30 3.50 C 08 PUMP 65 BBLS TPW DOWN TBG TO MAKESURE TBG WAS NOT

PLUGGED. MIX50 GALS POLIMER IN 500 BBLS TPW. SDFN
3/23/2010 07:00 -07:30 0.50 C 18 START RIG, HOLD SAFETY MEETING & CHECK DRAW WORKS

BRAKES.
07:30 -12:00 4.50 C 08 MIXPOLYMER IN TANK#2. PUMP 1459 BBLS TPW W/ POLYMER @

15 BPM. UNABLETO BREAK CIRCULATION.

RECEIVED May 28, 2010
Printed: 5/28/2010



May 28, 2010

EL PASO PRODUCTION Page 2 of 5

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: LAKE FORK 2-13B4
Common Well Name: LAKE FORK 2-13B4 Spud Date: 11/14/1985
Event Name: RECOMPLETION Start: 3/16/2010 End: 4/14/2010
Contractor Name: BASIC ENERGY SERVICES Rig Release: 4/14/2010 Group:
Rig Name: BASIC Rig Number: 1584

Sub iDate From - To Hours i Code
i Code Phase Description of Operations

3/23/2010 12:00 - 16:00 4.00 C 04 TOOH Wl TBG & MILLASSEMBLY. ENTIRE FACE OF 3 BLADE MILL
SHOWED WEAR, W/ MORE WEAR @CENTER OF MILL.SDFN

3/24/2010 07:00 -07:30 0.50 C 18 HOLD SAFETY MEETING, START RIG & CHECK DRAW WORKS
BRAKES

07:30 -13:00 5.50 C 04 TlH W/ 4-1/8" X 3-3/4" WASHOVER SHOE ASSEMBLY, 2-3/8" TBG &
2-7/8"TBG. RU POWER SWIVEL.

13:00 -15:00 2.00 C 13 TAG UP @ 11459'. PUMP TBG VOLUM @4 BPM.CLEAN OUT TO
11554', PUMPING 1.5 BPM TPW DOWN TBG. DRILLEDTHROUGH
BRIDGE. LOST 20K STRING WEIGHT. LD 2 JTS WI POWER
SWIVEL.

15:00 -16:30 1.50 C TOOH Wl50 JTS TBG, HAVINGTO WORK TBG AS NEEDE WHEN
HANGING UP IN LINER. SDFN W/EOT @9915'

3/25/2010 07:00 -07:30 0.50 C 18 HOLD SAFETY MEETING, START RIG & INSPECT DRAW WORKS
BRAKES

07:30 - 09:00 1.50 C 04 TlH W/50 JTS 2-7/8" TBG. TAG UP @ 11524'. RU PUMP & POWER
SWlVEL.

09:00 - 14:30 5.50 C 13 PUMP 60 BBLS TPW DOWN TBG. CLEAN OUT FROM 11524' TO
11634', WHILE PUMPING 1.5 TO 4 BPM DOWN TBG. STOPPED
MAKINGHOLE @ 11524'. RD POWER SWlVEL.LD 2 JTS TBG.

14:30 -16:00 1.50 C 18 PUMP 300 GAL 15% HCL ACID DOWN TBG, WHILE PUMPING 100
BBLS TPW DOWN CSG. RU RIG PUMP TO TBG. PUMP 10 BBLS
TPW DOWN TBG. PRESSURED UP TO 1000 PSI. LD 1 JT TBG.
PRESSURE DROPPED TO O PSI. CONTINUE SPOTTING ACID TO
EOT WI 66 TTL BBLS TPW.

16:00 -19:00 3.00 C 04 TOOH Wl TBG &WASHOVER SHOE BHA. SHOE WAS WORN FROM
3.05' LONG TO 1". PIECES OF STAINLESS STEEL, POSSIBLY
SPRINGS OFF OF TAC, WERE HUNG UP IN TOP 1" OF WASH PIPE
EXTENSION. DRAIN PUMP. SDFN

3/26/2010 09:30 - 13:30 4.00 C 04 TIH WI 4-1/8" X 3-3/4" WAVY BOTTOM SHOE, WASH PIPE
EXTENSION, SPRING DOG SUB, 1 JT 3-3/4" WASHPIPE, TOP
BUSHING, BUMPER SUB, JAR, 4 3-1/8' DRILLCOLLARS,
INTENSIFIER, X-OVER, 93 JTS 2-3/8"EUE TBG, X-OVER, 2-7/8" SEAT
NIPPLE & 265 JTS 2-7/8" TBG. RU POWER SWlVEL ON JT#266

13:30 - 18:00 4.50 C 13 PUMP 60 BBLS TPW DOWN TBG. TAG UP @ 11570'. WASH OVER
OBSTRUCTION IN 5" LINER TO 11595', WHILE PUMPING 335 BBLS
TPW @ 1.5 BPM

18:00 - 19:00 1.00 C 04 RD POWER SWIVEL. TOOH Wl122 JTS 2-7/8" TBG. SDFN
PUMPED 395 BBLS TPW TODAY

3/27/2010 07:00 -07:30 0.50 C 18 HOLD SAFETY MEETING, START RIG & CHECK DRAW WORKS
BRAKES

07:30 - 15:00 7.50 C TOOH WI TBG &WASHOVER ASSEMBLY. SHOE WAS WORN ON
FACE & ID. OUT SIDE OF WASHPIPE WAS SCARRED. TlH W/
3-7/8"OD OVERSHOT DRESSED TO FISH 2-7/8", BUSHING, 3-3/4"
WASHPIPE EXTENSION, TOP BUSHING, BUMPER SUB, JAR, 4
3-1/8" DRILLCOLLARS, INTENSIFIER, X-OVER, 93 JTJTS 2-3/8"EUE
TBG, X-OVER, &256 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG.TAG UP @ 11229' (355'
HIGH).

15:00 - 18:00 3.00 C RU POWER SWlVEL. PUMP 60 BBLS TPW DOWN TBG. ROTATE &
WORK TBG WHILE PUMPING 1 BPM TO 4 BPM DOWN TBG.
ROTATE &WORK TBG WHILE PUMPING 1 -4 BPM TPW DOWN
TBG. WORK OVERSHOT TO 11439'. AT THIS DEPTH TBG WOULD
PRESSURE UP TO 500 PSI WHILE SETTING DOWN 10K, & 300 PSI
WHILE IN NEUTRAL POSITION. RD POWER SWIVEL

RECEIVED May 28, 2010
Printed: 5/28/2010



May 28, 2010

EL PASO PRODUCT10N Page 3 of 5

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: LAKE FORK 2-13B4
Common Well Name: LAKE FORK 2-13B4 Spud Date: 11/14/1985
Event Name: RECOMPLETION Start: 3/16/2010 End: 4/14/2010
Contractor Name: BASIC ENERGY SERVICES Rig Release: 4/14/2010 Group:
Rig Name: BASIC Rig Number: 1584

SubDate From - To Hours Code Code Phase Description of Operations

3/27/2010 18:00 - 19:00 1.00 C 04 TOOH W/ 50 JTS 2-7/8" TBG.SDFN
PUMPED 392 BBLS TPW TODAY

3/28/2010 07:00 -07:30 0.50 C 18 HOLD SAFETY MEETING.START RIG & CHECK DRAW WORKS
BRAKES

07:30 - 09:00 1.50 C 13 RU PUMP & PUMP 70 BBLS TPW DOWN TBG @0 PSI. TlH W/ TBG
& TOOLS. TAG UP @ 11440'. RU POWER SWIVEL. ROTATE &
WORK TBG WHILE PUMPING DOWN TBG & 1 - 4 BPM. UNABLE TO
WORK DEEPER.

09:00 - 15:30 6.50 C 04 RD POWER SWlVEL. TOOH W/ TBG & TOOLS. RECOVERED 2
PIECES OFTWISTED IRON IN OVERSHOT. TlH Wl4-1/8"OD X 3-3/4"
WASHPIPE SHOE, BUSHING, OVERSHOT DRESSED 2-7/8",
BUSHING, 3-3/4" WASHPIPE EXTENSION. BUMPER SUB,JAR, 4
3-1/8" DRILLCOLLARS, INTENSIFIER, X-OVER, 93NJTS 2-3/8" EUE
TBG, X-OVER & 256 JTS 2-7/8" TBG. TAG UP @ 11231'.

15:30 - 18:00 2.50 C 13 RU POWER SWlVEL. WORK & ROTATE TBG WHILE PUMPING
DOWN TBG @ 1 -4 BPM. WORK SHOE TO 11603' WHILE PUMPING
1 - 4 BPM DOWN TBG.

18:00 -19:00 1.00 C 04 RD POPWER SWlVEL TOOH W/ 50 JTS 2-7/8" TBG. SDFN
PUMPED 446 BBLS TPW TODAY

3/29/2010 06:00-06:00 NO ACTIVETY TODAY. SHUT DOWN FOR SUNDAY
3/30/2010 07:00 -07:30 0.50 C 18 , HOLD SAFETY MEETING, START RIG & INSPECT DRAW WORKS

i BRAKES
07:30 -08:00 0.50 C 08 RU PUMP & PUMP LINES. PUMP 70 BBLS TPW DOWN TBG @0 PSI.
08:00 -08:30 0.50 C 04 TlH W/ OVERSHOT ASSEMBLY. TAG UP @ 11553', (50' HIGH).
08:30 - 10:30 2.00 C 13 ROTATE &WORK TBG WHILE PUMPING DOWN TBG @2 BPM.

WORK OVERSHOT DOWN TO 11571'. LOST 20000# ON WEIGHT
INDICATER. SWIVEL OUT OF HOLE TO 11412'. STILL UNABLETO
GO IN HOLE W/ TBG. RD POWER SWIVEL

10:30 - 17:30 7.00 C 04 TOOH W/ TBG & OVERSHOT ASSEMBLY. RECOVERED HEAD OF
WASHOVER SHOE THAT WAS LEFT IN HOLE. TlH W/ SPRING DOG
OVERSHOT, BUSHING, 3-7/8" OVERSHOT DRESSED 2-7/8",
BUSHING, WASHPIPE EXTENSION, TOP BUSHING, BUMPER SUB,
JAR, 4 3-1/8" DRILLCOLLARS, INTENSIFIER, 93 JTS 2-3/8"EUE TBG,
X-OVER & 213 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. SDFN
PUMPED 207 BBLS TPW TODAY

3/31/2010 07:00 -07:30 0.50 C 18 HOLD SAFETY MEETING, START RIG & INSPECT DRAW WORKS
BRAKES

07:30 -08:00 0.50 C 04 TIH W/ 50 JTS 2-7/8" TBG. TAG UP @ 11348'.
08:00 - 10:00 2.00 C 13 RU TBG SWIVEL. WORK OVERSHOT TO 11539' WHILE PUMPING 1

BPM TO 4 BPM TPW DOWN TBG. COULD NOT GO DEEPER.
10:00 - 18:00 8.00 C 04 TOOH W/ TBG & OVERSHOT ASSEMBLY. RECOVERED SMALL

PIECE OF IRON & CMT IN SPRING DOG. LD FISHING TOOLS. TIH
Wl 4-1/8" MILL& BAILERASSEMBLY. SDFN

4/1/2010 07:00 -07:30 0.50 C 18 HOLD SAFETY MEETING, START RIG & INSPECT DRAW WORKS
BRAKES

07:30 -09:00 1.50 C 04 CONTINUE TlH WI BAILERASSEMBLY. TAG UP @ 10300".
09:00 -10:30 1.50 C 13 WORK BAILER. CLEAN OUT LINER TO 11300'. STOPPED MAKINT

HOLE
10:30 - 13:30 3.00 C 04 TOOH W/ TBG & BAILER. RECOVERED FORMATION & CMT IN

BAILER CAVITY.
13:30 - 15:30 2.00 C 11 RU WIRELINE TRUCK. RlH & SET CIBP @ 10600'. RD WIRELINE

15:30 - 16:30 1.00 C 09
FIRLCKSG

W/ 130 BBLS 2% KCLWTR. PRESSURE TEST CSG TO

RECEIVED May 28, 2010
Printed: 5/28/2010



May 28, 2010

EL PASO PRODUCTION Page 4 of 5

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: LAKE FORK 2-13B4
Common Well Name: 1.AKEFORK 2-13B4 Spud Date: 11/14/1985
Event Name: RECOMPLETION Start: 3/16/2010 End: 4/14/2010
Contractor Name: 13ASICENERGY SERVICES Rig Release: 4/14/2010 Group:
Rig Name: 13ASIC Rig Number: 1584

Date From - To Hours Code Phase Descriptioriof Operations

4/1/2010 15:30 - 16:30 1.00 C 09 1000 PSI FOR 15 MINUTES. OK, SDFN
PUMPED 275 BBLS TPW & 130 BBLS 2% KCLWTR TODAY

4/2/2010 07:00 -07:30 0.50 C 18 HOLD SAFETY MEETING, START RIG & INSPECT DRAW WORKS
BRAKES

07:30 -10:00 2.50 C 04 TlH Wl92 JTS 2-3/8"EUE TBG OUT OF DERRICK & LAYDOWN
SAME, FLUSHING AS NEEDED

10:00 -22:30 12.50 C 11 RU CASED HOLE SOLUTIONS WIRELINE TRUCKS. RIH Wl3-1/8"
PERF GUN. SET DOWN @ 10588'. UNABLETO SHOOT BOTTOM 2
SHOTS, 10591' TO 10592' & 10595' TO 10596'. PERF FROM 8931' TO
10580' Wl3-1/8" HSC GUNS, 120 DEGREE PHASING &22.7 GRAM
CHARGES. SAW NO PRESSURE OR FLUID LEVEL CHANGE
DURING PERFORATING OPERATIONS. RD WIRELINE TRUCK

22:30 -00:00 1.50 C 04 TIH Wl7" PKR & 50 JTS 3-1/2"EUE P110 TBG. SDFN
4/3/2010 06:00-06:00 SHUT DOWN FOR EASTER WEEKEND
4/4/2010 06:00 -06:00 SHUT DOWN FOR EASTER WEEKEND
4/5/2010 06:00-06:00 SHUT DOWN FOR EASTER WEEKEND
4/6/2010 06:00 -07:00 1.00 C 18 CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFTEY MTNG, PERFORMED JSA.

07:00 - 12:00 5.00 C 04 SITP-200#. SICP-200#. BLED OFF WELL. TALLIED3 1/2" PIPE ON
RACKS. CONTINUED RIH PU 3 1/2" TBG. A TOTAL OF 231 JNTS,
FOR A TOTAL OF 281 JNTS 31/2" P-110 EUE 8 RND. SET 7" PKR @
8,879' IN 40,000# COMPRESION.

12:00 - 13:00 1.00 C 18 RU PMP & LINES FILLCSNG Wl90 BBLS 2% KCL PRESSURE TEST
PKR & CSNG TO 1,000 PSI. HELD PRESS FOR 10 MINUTES GOOD
TEST. BLED PRESSURE OFF, SHUT WELL IN. S.D.F.N.
PKR SET @8,879'.
PMPED A TOTAL OF 90 BBLS 2% KCL FOR THE DAY.

13:00 - 14:00 1.00 C 18 CREW TRAVEL.
4/7/2010 06:00 -06:00 NO RIG ACTIVITYWAITING ON HALIBURTON'S PUMPING

EQUIPMENT.
4/8/2010 06:00-06:00 NO RIG ACTIVITY,SHUT DOWN WAITING ON FRAC EQUIPMENT.

4/12/2010.
4/9/2010 06:00 -06:00 NO RIG ACTIVITY,WAITING ON HALIBURTONS FRAC EQUIPMENT

ON 4/12/2010.
4/10/2010 06:00-06:00 NO RIG ACTIVITY.SHUT DOWN WAITING ON FRAC EQUIPMENT

UNTIL4-12-2010
4/11/2010 06:00-06:00 NO RIG ACTIVITY,RIG SHUT DOWN WAITING FOR FRAC

EQUIPMENT UNTIL4-12-2010.
4/12/2010 06:00-06:00 NO RIG ACTIVITY,SHUT DOWN WAITING ON FRAC EQUIPMENT

UNTIL4-12-2010.
4/13/2010 06:00 -07:00 1.00 C 18 CREW TRAVEL, HELD SAFTEY MTNG W/ HALIBURTON.

PERFORMED JSA.
TSIP-400 P.S.I. CSIP-0 P.S.l.

07:00 -11:30 4.50 C 21 MIRU HALIBURTON FRAC EQUIPMENT. PRESS TEST LINES &
ERQUIPMENT TO 8,500 P.S.I.
START PMPING Wl15% HCL WELL BROKE @6,515#. CONT
STAGE #1 PMPED 2876 GAL 15% HCL ACID. STAGE #2 SPACER W/
1751 GAL 10# BRINE Wl ROCK SALT. STAGE #3 W/2561 GAL 15%
HCL ACID. STAGE #4 Wl 1595 GAL 10# BRINE W/ ROCK SALT.
STAGE #5 W/ 2576 GAL 15% HCL ACID. STAGE #6 W/ 1531 GAL 10#
BRINE WI ROCK SALT. STAGE #7 Wl2639 GAL 15% HCL ACID.
STAGE #8 W/ 1551 GAL 10# BRINE W/ ROCK SALT. STAGE #9 WI
3202 GAL 15% HCL ACID. FLUSHED ACID Wl5875 GAL 2% KCL.
DROPPED A TOTAL OF 363 BIO-BALLS FOR DIVERSION THROUGH

RECEIVED May 28, 2010
Printed: 5/28/2010



May 28, 2010

EL PASO PRODUCTION Page 5 01 s

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: LAKE FORK 2-13B4
Common Well Name: LAKE FORK 2-13B4 Spud Date: 11/14/1985
Event Name: RECOMPLETION Start: 3/16/2010 End: 4/14/2010
Contractor Name: BASIC ENERGY SERVICES Rig Release: 4/14/2010 Group:
Rig Name: BASIC Rig Number: 1584

Date From - To Hours Code Su Phase Description of Operations

4/13/2010 07:00 - 11:30 . 4.50 C 21 OUT ACID STAGES. ISIP-1099#. 5 MIN - 652#. 10 MIN - 455#. 15 MIN -

328#. BLEW WELL DOWN TO FLAT TNK. RIG DOWN HALIBURTON
FRAC EQUIPMENT.

11:30 - 16:00 4.50 C 04 RELEASE 7" TRTING PKR. POOH LAYlNGDOWN 281 JNTS 3 1/2"
TBNG AND 7" PKR.

16:00 - 17:00 1.00 C 18 X-O TO 27/8" TBNG EQUIPMENT. RAM BLOCKS, TBG ELEVATORS,
SLIPS, ECT.

17:00 -18:30 1.50 C 04 RIH W/ PROD BHA & 70 JNTS 27/8" N-80 TBG.
EOT @2,514'.
S.D.F.N.

18:30 - 19:30 1.00 C 18 CREW TRAVEL.
4/14/2010 06:00 -07:00 1.00 C 18 CREW TRAVEL, HELD SAFTEY MTNG, PERFORMED JSA.

07:00 -11:30 4.50 C 04 NO PRESSURE ON WELL. TIH Wl180 JNTS 27/8" FS-150 TBG
FROM DERRICK. PU 28 JNTS 27/8" FS-150 OFF RACKS. PU 4 JNTS
27/8" N-80 EUE TBG FROM RACK. LANDTBG ON HANGER. ND
B.O.P. SET TAC @8,899'Wl20,000 TENSION. RELAND TBNG. NU
WH. RU HOT OILER FLUSH TBG W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCLWTR.X-O TO
ROD EQUIPMENT,

11:30 - 16:00 4.50 C 04 PU & PRIME 2 1/2" X 1 1/2" X 28' RHBC ROD PUMP. RIH W/ 24-1" EL
RODS, 124-3/4" EL RODS, 110-7/8" EL RODS, 100-1" EL RODS. PU
& SPACE OUT PMP W/ 6', 4', 2'X 1" PONY RODS.
RU HOT OILER TO TBG. FILLTBG W/ 10 BBLS 2% KCL. PRESS &
STROKE TEST ROD PMP TO 1,000 P.S.I. GOOD TEST.

16:00 - 17:00 1.00 C 18 HANG HORSES HEAD ON PMPING UNIT. STEAM CLEAN TOOLS &
EQUIPMENT. RACK OUT PMP LINES AND EQUIPMENT.

17:00 - 19:00 2.00 C 01 RIG DOWN SERVICE RIG.
UNABLETO RUN PUMPING UNIT DUE TO HOLE IN FIRE TUBE AT
TREATER.
TURN WELL OVER TO PRODUCTION DEPT.

RECEIVED May 28, 2010
Printed: 5/28/2010



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 LAKE FORK 2-13B4 R 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43013311340000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0819 FSL 0963 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWSW Section: 13 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

9/26/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: Convert to ESP

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Change from rods to ESP.  

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038

TITLE
 Sr. Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 8/23/2011

08/31/2011

Aug. 23, 2011

Sundry Number: 17793 API Well Number: 43013311340000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well LAKE FORK 2-13B4 R

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP 43013311340000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 E×t ALTAMONT

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

0819 FSL 0963 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: SWSW Section: 13 Township: 02.05 Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

9/26/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Convert to ESP

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Change from rods to ESP.

Approved by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: 08/31/2 1

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Sr. Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



Lake Fork Ranch 2-13B4 Procedure Summary 

• POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing 

• RIH w/ BHA, ESP, and tubing. 

• Clean location & restore production 
 

 

Aug. 23, 2011

Sundry Number: 17793 API Well Number: 43013311340000

Lake Fork Ranch 2-13B4 Procedure Summary
• POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing
• RIH w/ BHA, ESP, and tubing.
• Clean location & restore



Don Staley - Re: El Paso Well Name Corrections (Remove 'R' from name) 

  
Dustin, 
  
I can't find any explanation for why the 'R' was added, but it first appeared on the February 2002 Production 
Book.  That means the well name change took place somewhere between June 6, 2002 (when the January 2002 
book was run) and July 2, 2002 (when the February 2002 book was run).  There was nothing in the database 
comments or the well file showing that the operator requested a name change.  I removed the 'R' from the well 
name in the database and will include a copy of this message in the well file for documentation. 
  
The same story applies to all of these El Paso wells and all have been corrected: 
  
Murdock 2-34B5 R    (4301331132) 
Murdock 2-26B5 R    (4301331124) 
Robb 2-29B5 R         (4301331130) 
Ute 2-33Z2 R           (4301331111) 
Jenkins 2-12B3 R      (4301331121) 
Lake Fork 2-13B4 R   (4301331134) 
Hanson 2-9B3 R        (4301331136) 
Ute 2-31A2 R            (4301331139) 
Lindsay 2-33A4 R      (4301331141) 
  
Don 
 
>>> Dustin Doucet 12/28/2011 5:10 PM >>> 
Don, 
  
El Paso called wondering where the "R" came from on the well name for the Murdock 2-34B5 well (in database 
as Murdock 2-34B5 R).  No notes as to a name change all documents prior to the recent electronic submittals 
did not have R, the two electronic docs have the R indicating the DB had been changed prior to that date.  
Unless we are missing pages that would have been 2001 at the latest.  Probably somebody accidently hit a 
button to add it when they were adding something to the record for this well.  Hopefully not a more serious 
issue.  At any rate,  El Paso doesn't want the R on there, wondered why it was done.  I told them we would take 
it off and didn't know how it came to be.  Can you take care of this?  Thanks. 
  
Dustin 

From:    Don Staley
To:    Dustin Doucet
Date:    01/04/2012 9:15 AM
Subject:   Re: El Paso Well Name Corrections (Remove 'R' from name)

Page 1 of 1

1/4/2012file://C:\Documents and Settings\dstaley\Local Settings\Temp\XPgrpwise\4F04189ANRDO...
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Don Staley - Re: El Paso Well Name Corrections (Remove 'R' from name)

From: Don Staley
To: Dustin Doucet
Date: 01/04/2012 9:15 AM
Subject: Re: El Paso Well Name Corrections (Remove 'R' from name)

Dustin,

I can't find any explanation for why the 'R' was added, but it first appeared on the February 2002 Production
Book. That means the well name change took place somewhere between June 6, 2002 (when the January 2002
book was run) and July 2, 2002 (when the February 2002 book was run). There was nothing in the database
comments or the well file showing that the operator requested a name change. I removed the 'R' from the well
name in the database and will include a copy of this message in the well file for documentation.

The same story applies to all of these El Paso wells and all have been corrected:

Murdock 2-34B5 R (4301331132)
Murdock 2-26B5 R (4301331124)
Robb 2-29B5 R (4301331130)
Ute 2-33Z2 R (4301331111)
Jenkins 2-12B3 R (4301331121)
Lake Fork 2-13B4 R (4301331134)
Hanson 2-9B3 R (4301331136)
Ute 2-31A2 R (4301331139)
Lindsay 2-33A4 R (4301331141)

Don

>>> Dustin Doucet 12/28/2011 5:10 PM >>>

Don,

El Paso called wondering where the "R" came from on the well name for the Murdock 2-34B5 well (in database
as Murdock 2-34B5 R). No notes as to a name change all documents prior to the recent electronic submittals
did not have R, the two electronic docs have the R indicating the DB had been changed prior to that date.
Unless we are missing pages that would have been 2001 at the latest. Probably somebody accidently hit a
button to add it when they were adding something to the record for this well. Hopefully not a more serious
issue. At any rate, El Paso doesn't want the R on there, wondered why it was done. I toldthem we would take
it off and didn't know how it came to be. Can you take care of this? Thanks.

Dustin

file://C:\Documents and Settings\dstaley\Local Settings\Temp\XPgrpwise\4F04189ANRDO...



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2012

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N3065- El Paso E&P Company, L.P. N3850- EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX. 77002 Houston, TX. 77002

Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038 Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038

CA No. Unit: N/A

LL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/25/2012
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/25/2012
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/27/2012
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 2114377-0181
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Yes
Sb. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: N/A
Sc. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 6/25/2012
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM N/A BIA Not Received
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: N/A
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: Second Oper Chg
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/29/2012
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/29/2012
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/29/:2012
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: N/A
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JUO705
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 6/29/2012
COMMENTS:
Disposal and Injections wells willbe moved when UIC 5 is received.

El Paso.xis



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

Multiple Leases
6 IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do notuse thisform for proposals to drillnewwells,significantlydeepen existingwells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, orto
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER See Attached

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

El Paso E&P Company, L.P. Attn: Maria Gomez
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1001 Louisiana ciTY Houston STATE TX ZIP 77002 (713) 997-5038 See Attached
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See Attached COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

« CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACl( WATER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOr10inalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUC1NG FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Change of
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Name/Operator

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please be advised that El Paso E&P Company, L.P. (current Operator) has changed names to EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
(new Operator) effective June 1, 2012 and that EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is considered the new operator of the attached
well locations.

EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is responsible under the termsand conditionsof the lease(s) for the operations conducted
upon leased lands. Bond coverage is provided by the State of Utah Statewide Blanket Bond No. 400JUO705, Bureau of Land
Management Nationwide Bond No. 103601420, and Bureau of Indian Affairs Nationwide Bond No. 103601473.

Frank W. Fallerr Frank W. Falleri
Vice President Sr. Vice President
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.

NAME(PLEAS NT) Maria S. Gomez TITLE Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE

E

DATE 6/22/2012

(ThisspaceforStateuseonly) RECEIVED
D JUN2 5 2012

. . . _ gee instrucuans on Reverse sd•) Olv.0F OIL,GAS&MINING"°°bivision of Oil,Gasand Mining-
Earlenekussell, Engineering Techniclaa



El Paso E1 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E1 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

Well Well
Well Name Sec TWP RNG API Number Entity Lease Type Type Status Conf
DVVR3-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301350070 14204621118 OVV APD C
LAKEWOOD ESTATES 3-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301350127 1420H621328 OW APD C
YOUNG3-15A3 15 010S 030W 4301350122 FEE OW APD C
WHITING4-1A2 01 010S 020W 4301350424 Fee OW APD C
ELFUMSO4-34A4 34 010S 040VV 4301350720 Fee OVV APD C
YOUNG 2-281 02 020S 010W 4304751180 FEE OW APD C
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-1084 10 020S 040W 4301350712 18221 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-2684 26 020S 040W 4301350714 18432 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-24B4 24 020S 040W 4301350717 18315 Fee OW DRL C
Cook4-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301351162 18449 Fee OVV DRL C
Peterson4-22C6 22 030S 060VV 4301351163 18518 Fee OVV DRL C
LakeForkRanch4-14B4 14 020S 040VV 4301351240 99999 Fee 04V DRL C
Ahelesco4-20C6 20 030S 060VV 4301351241 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Peck3-13BS 13 020S 050VV 4301351364 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Jensen2-9C4 09 030S 040VV 4301351375 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
El Paso 3-5C4 05 030S 040W 4301351376 18563 Fee OW DRL C
ULT6-31 31 030S 020E 4304740033 FEE O\¾ LA
OBERHANSLY 2-2A1 02 010S 010W 4304740164 FEE OW LA
DWR 3-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301351433 14-20-H62-4724 OW NEW C
LakeForkRanch5-23B4 23 0208 040VV 4301360739 Fee CNV NEVV
DuchesneLand4-10C5 10 030S 050VV 4301351262 Fee OVV NEVV C
Cabinland 4-9B3 09 020S 030W 4301351374 Fee OW NEW C
Layton 4-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301351389 Fee OW NEW C
Golinski4-24BS 24 020S 050VV 4301351404 Fee OiN NE\N C
AII>a1-21C4 21 030S 040VV 4301351460 Fee 04V NEVV C
Allison4-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301351466 Fee ONV NEVV C
Seeley 4-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301351486 Fee OW NEW C
Allen4-25B5 25 020S 050VV 4301351487 Fee OVV NEVV C
Hewett 2-6C4 06 030S 040W 4301351489 Fee OW NEW C
Young2-7C4 07 030S 040VV 4301351500 Fee OVV NEVV C
Brighton 3-31A1E 31 010S 010E 4304752471 Fee OW NEW C
Hamaker3-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304752491 Fee OVV NEVV C
Bolton3-29A1E 29 010S 010E 4304752871 Fee OVV NEVV C
HORROCKS5-20A1 20 010S 010W 4301334280 17378 FEE OW OPS C
DWR 3-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301334263 17440 14-20-462-1120 OW P
DWR 3-22C6 22 030S 060W 4301334106 17298 14-20-462-1131 OW P
DWR 3-28C6 28 030S 060W 4301334264 17360 14-20-462-1323 OW P
UTE 1-7A2 07 010S 020W 4301330025 5850 14-20-462-811 OW
UTE2-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301331033 10115 14-20-H62-1118 OiN P
WLRTRIBAL2-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301331035 10250 14-20-H62-1120 OW P
CEDAR RIM 10-A-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330615 6420 14-20-H62-1128 OW P
CEDAR RIM 12A B 030S 060W 4301331173 10672 14-20-H62-1323 OW P
UTE-FEE 2-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301331123 10365 14-20-H62-1328 OW P
TAYLOR3-34C6 34 030S 060VV 4301350200 17572 1420H621329 CNV P
BAKER UTE 2-34C6 34 030S 060W 4301332634 14590 14-20-H62-1329 OW P
UTE 3-35Z2 K 35 010N 020W 4301331133 10483 14-20-H62-1614 OW P
UTE 1-32Z2 32 010N 020W 4301330379 1915 14-20-H62-1702 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-33D 33 010N 020W 4301330334 1851 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTE 2-33Z2 33 010N 020W 4301331111 10451 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTETRIBAL2-34Z2 010N 020W 4301331167 10668 14-20-H62-1704 OW
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-13B4 13 020S 040W 4301334262 17439 14-20-H62-1743 OW P
Üii 1-28B4 28 020S 040VV 4301330242 1796 14-20-H62-1745 OVV P
UTE 1-34A4 34 010S 040W 4301330076 1585 14-20-H62-1774 OW P
UTE 1-36A4 36 010S 040VV 4301330069 1580 14-20-H62-1793 (MN P
UTE 1-1B4 01 020S 040W 4301330129 1700 14-20-H62-1798 OW P
UTE 1-31A2 31 010S 020VV 4301330401 1925 14-20-H62-1801 (MN P |



El Paso E2 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E2 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE1-25A3 25 010S 030VV4301330370 1920 'Wi-20-H62-1802 OVV P
UTE 2-25A3 25 010S 030W 4301331343 11361 14-20-H62-1802 OW P
UTE 1-26A3 26 OS 030W 4301330348 1890 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTE 2-26A3 26 010S 030W 4301331340 11349 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTETRIBAL4-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301350274 18009 1420H621804 OVV P C
UTE 2-35A3 35 010S 030W 4301331292 11222 14-20-H62-1804 ÖW P
UTE3-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301331365 11454 14-20-H62-1804 OIVV P
UTE 145B2 06 0208: 020VV4301330349 1895 14-20-H62-1807 O\N P
UTE 2-6B2 06 020S 020W 4301331140 11190 14-20-H62-1807 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-682 06 020S 020W 4301350273 18008 14-20-H62-1807 OW P C
POWELL 4-19A1 19 010S 010W 4301330071 8302 14-20-H62-1847 OW P
COLTHARP 1-27Z1 27 010N 010W 4301330151 4700 14-20-H62-1933 OW P
UTE 1-8A1E 08 010S 010E 4304730173 1846 14-20-H62-2147 OW P
UTETRIBE 1-31 31 010N 020VV 4301330278 4755 14-20-H62-2.421 OVV P
UTE 1-28B6X 28 020S 060W 4301330510 11165 14-20-H62-2492 OW P
RINKER 2-21B5 21 020S 050W 4301334166 17299 14-20-H62-2508 OW P
MURDOCK 2-34B5 34 020S 050W 4301331132 10456 14-20-H62-2511 OW P
LffE 1-3586 [35 0206; 060VV4301330507 2335 14-20-H62-2531 O\N P
UTE TRIBAL1-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304730829 860 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE 2-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304737831 16709 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE TRIBAL1-27A1E \27 010S 010E 4304730421 800 14-20-H62-2662 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-35A1E 35 010S 010E 4304730286 795 14-20-H62-2665 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-15A1E 15 010S 010E 4304730820 850 14-20-H62-2717 OW P
UTE TRIBAL P-3B1E 03 02 S 010E 4304730190 4536 14-20-H62-2873 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-22ATE 22 010S 010E 4304730429 810 14-20-H62-3103 OW P
BHUTE1-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301330419 10705 14-20-H62-3436 09/ P
BHUTE2-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301332790 15802 14-20-H62-3436 OV/ P
MCFARLANE 1-4D6 04 040S 060W 4301331074 10325 14-20-H62-3452 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-11D6 11 040S 060W 4301330482 6415 14-20-H62-3454 OW P
CARSON 2-36A1 36 010S 010W 4304731407 737 14-20-H62-3806 OW P
UTE 2-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301330775 9133 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
DWR 3-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301334003 17092 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
THE PERFECT "10" 1-10A1 10 010S 010W 4301330935 9461 14-20-H62-3855 OW
BADGER-SAM HU MONGUS1-15A1 15 010S 010W 4301330949 9462 14-20-H62-3860 OW P
MAXIMILLIAN-UTE14-1 14 010S 030W 4301330726 8437 14-20-H62-3868 OW P
FRED BASSETT 1-22A1 22 010S 010W 4301330781 9460 14-20-H62-3880 OW
UTETRIBAL1-30Z1 30 010N 010VV 4301330813 9405 14-20-H62-3910 OVV P
UTE LB 1-13A3 13 010S 030W 4301330894 9402 14-20-H62-3980 OW P
UTE2-22B6 22 020S 060VV 4301331444 11641 14-20-H62-4614 OVV P
UINTA QURAY 1-1A3 01 010S 030W 4301330132 5540 14-20-H62-4664 OW P
UTE 1-6D6 06 040S 060W 4301331696 12058 14-20-H62-4752 0W
UTE2-11D6 11 040S 060VV 4301350179 17667 1420H624801 OVV P
LÏÑï1-15D6 15 040S 060VV 4301330429 10958 14-20-H62-4824 OVV P
UTE2-15D6 15 040S 060W 4301334026 17193 14-20-H624824 OW
HILL3-24C6 24 030S 060VV 4301350293 18020 1420H624866 OVV P C
BARCLAYUTE 2-24C6R 24 030S 060W 4301333730 16385 14-20-H62-4866 OW P
BROTHERSON 1-2B4 |02 020S 040W 4301330062 1570 FEE OW P
BOREN 1-24A2 24 010S 020W 4301330084 5740 FEE _ 0W
FARNSWORTH 1-13BS 13 020S 050W 4301330092 1610 FEE OW P
BROADHEAD 1-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301330100 1595 FEE OW P
ASAYEJ 1-20A1 20 010S 010VV 4301330102 8304 FEE OVV P
HANSONTRUST 1-5B3 05 020S 030W 4301330109 1635 FEE OW P
ELLSO/ORTH1-8B4 08 020S 040VV 4301330112 1655 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-9B4 09 020S 040VV 4301330118 1660 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-17B4 17 020S 040VV 4301330126 1695 FEE OVV P
CHANDLER1-5B4 05 020S 040VV 4301330140 1685 FEE OVV P
HANSON1-32A3 32 010S 030VV 4301330141 1640 FEE OVV P
JESSEN 1-17A4 17 010S 040VV 4301330173 4725 FEE OVV P



El Paso E3 Company, LP. (N3065) to EP Energy E3 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

JENKINS1-1B3 01 020S 030VV 4301330175 1790 FEE O¾V P
GOODRICH 1-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301330182 1765 FEE OW P
ELLSVVORTH1-19B4 19 020S 040VV 4301330183 1760 FEE ONV P
O(TYLE1-10B3 10 020S 030VV 4301330187 1810 FEE OVV P
JOS. SMITH1-17C5 17 iO30S 050W 4301330188 5510 FEE OW
RUDY 1-11B3 11 020S 030W \43013302041820 FEE OW
CROCu(1-BB4 06 020S 040VV 4301330213 1825 FEE OVV P
HUNT1-21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301330214 1840 FEE OVV P
LAVVRENCE1-30B4 30 020S 040VV 4301330220 1845 FEE ONV P
YOUNK31-29B4 29 020S 040VV 4301330246 1791 FEE 04V P
GRIFFITHS1-33B4 33 020S 040W 4301330288 4760 FEE OW
PCrrTER1-2B5 02 020S 050VV 4301330293 1826 FEE DVV P
BRCITHERSCR41-26B4 26 020S 040VV 4301330336 1856 FEE ONV P
SADIEMBLANK1-33Z1 33 010N 010VV 4301330355 765 FEE OVV P
PCFEFER 1-24B5 24 020S 050VV 4301330356 1730 FEE O\N P
VVHITEHELAD1-22A3 22 010S: 030VV 4301330357 1885 FEE OVV P
CHASELMILLER2-1A2 01 010S 0200/ 4301330360 5830 FEE OWI P
ELDER1-13B2 13 020S 020VV 4301330366 1905 FEE OVV P
BROTHERSON 2-10B4 10 020S 040W 4301330443 1615 FEE OW P
FARNSWORTH 2-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301330470 1935 FEE OW P
TEVV1-15A3 15 010S 030VV 4301330529 1945 FEE OVV P
UTEFEE2-20C5 20 030S 050VV 4301330550 4527 FEE ONV P
FN3USTCad1-34Z1 34 010N 010VV 4301330566 885 FEE OVV P
GALLOVVAY1-18B1 18 020S 010VV 4301330575 2365 FEE OVV P
SMfTH1-31B5 31 020S 050VV 4301330577 1955 FEE OVV P
LEBEAU 1-34A1 34 010S 010W 4301330590 1440 FEE OW P
LINMAR1-19B2 19 020S 020VV 4301330600 9350 FEE O\N P
AflSSE1-28Z1 28 010N 010VV 4301330609 905 FEE ONV P
POVVELL1-21B1 21 020S 010VV 4301330621 910 FEE OVV P
HANSEN 1-24B3 24 020S 030VV 4301330629 2390 FEE OVV P
OhAAN2-4B4 04 020S 040VV 4301330645 9125 FEE OVV P
DYE 1-25Z2 25 010N 020W 4301330659 9111 FEE OW
HMARTIN 1-21Z1 21 010N 010VV 4301330707 925 FEE OVV P
JENSEN 1-29Z1 29 010N 010W 4301330725 9110 FEE OW P
CHASEL2-17A1V 17 010S 010VV 4301330732 9112 FEE OVV P
BIRCHELL 1-27A1 27 010S 010W 4301330758 940 FEE OW P
CHRISTENSEN2-8B3 08 020S 030W 4301330780 9355 FEE OW
LAMICQ2-SB2 05 020S 020W 4301330784 2302 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 2-14B4 14 020S 040W 4301330815 10450 FEE OW P
WRJRRAA'3-2A2 02 010S 020VVl4301330816 9620 FEE OVV P
HORROCKS2-20A1 V 20 010S 010W 4301330833 8301 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON2-2B4 02 020S 040W 4301330855 8420 FEE ÒV\Ï P
ELLSVVORTH2-8B4 08 020S 040VV 4301330898 2418 FEE OVV P
Òhi4N2-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301330904110045 FEE OVV P
BELCHER2-33B4 33 020S 040VV4301330907 9865 FEE OVV P
BROTHERSON 2-35B5 35 020S 050W 4301330908 9404 FEE OW
HORROCKS 2-4A1 T 04 010S 010W 4301330954 9855 FEE OW P
JENSEN2-29A5 29 010S 050VV4301330974 10040 FEE OVV P
UTE2-34A4 34 010S 040VV 4301330978 10070 FEE OVV P
CHANDLER2-5B4 05 020S 040VV 4301331000 10075 FEE OVV
BABCOCK2-1284 12 020S 040VV 4301331005 10215 FEE OW/ P
BADGER MR BOOM BOOM 2-29A1 29 010S 010W 4301331013 9463 FEE OW
BLEAJAARD2-18B4 18 020S 040VV4301331025 1566 FEE OVV P
BROADHEAD 2-32B5 32 020S 050W 4301331036 10216 FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-1684 16 0208 040W 43013Š1046 10217 FEE OW
RUST3-4B3 04 020S 030VV4301331070 1576 FEE OVV P
HANSON TRUST 2-32Äi 3i 030W 4ŠÕT331072154T ËËË ÒŸÏ P
BROTHElfSOffž-fiŠÀ 02ÕŠÏ040W 4301331078 1541 FEE OW P



El Paso E4 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E4 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HANSONTRUST2-5B3 05 020S 0309/ 4301331079 1636 FEE ONV P
BROTHERSON 2-15B4 15 020S 040W 4301331103 1771 FEE OW P
MONSEN2-27A3 27 010S 030W 4301331104 1746 FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-19B4 19 020S 040W 4301331105 1761 FEE OW P
HUNT2-;21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301331114 1839 FEE OVV P
JENKINS2-1B3 _ 01 020S 030W 4301331117 1792 FEE OW P
PCTTTER2-24BS 24 020S 050VV4301331118 1731 FEE OVV P
POVVELL2-13A2 K 13 010S 020VV 4301331120 8306 FEE OVV P
JENKINS 2-12B3 12 020S 030W 4301331121 10459 FEE OW P
MURDCK3K2-26B5 26 020S 050VV 4301331124 1531 FEE O\N P
BIRCH 3-27B5 27 020S 050W 4301331126 1783 FEE OW P
ROBB 2-2985 29 020S 050W 4301331130 10454 FEE OW P
LAKEFORK2-13B4 13 020S 040VV 4301331134 10452 FEE OVV P
DUNCAN 3-1A2 K 01 010S 020W 4301331135 10484 FEE OW P
HAJ4SON2-983 09 0208; 030VV 4301331136 10455 FEE O\N P
ELLSVIORTH2-9B4 09 0208 040VV 4301331138 10460 FEE OVV P
UTE2-31A2 31 010S 020VV 4301331139 10458 FEE OVV P
POVVELL2-19A1 K 19 010S 010VV 4301331149 8303 FEE OVV P
CEDAR RIM 8-A 22 030S 060W 4301331171 10666 FEE OW P
POTTER 2-684 06 0208 040W 4301331249 11038 FEE OW P
MILES2-1B5 Oi 020S 050W 4301331257 11062 FEE ÒW
MILES2-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301331261 11102 FEE OW P
MONSEN 2-22A3 22 010S 030W 4301331265 11098 FEE OW P
M/RK3HT2-13B5 13 020S 050VV 4301331267 11115 FEE VV P
TODD2-21A3 21 010S 030W 4301331296 11268 FEE OW P
VVElit4RT2-29B4 3Ï 020S 040VV 4301331298 11332 FEE lOVV P
YOUNG2-15A3 15 010S 030W 4301331301 11344 FEE
CHRISTENSEN2-29A4 29 010S 040VV 4301331303 11235 FEE O\N I
BLEAZARD2-28B4 28 020S 040W 4301331304 11433 FEE OW P
REARY2-17A3 17 010S 030W 4301331318 11251 FEE OW P
LAZYK2-11B3 11 020S 030VV 4301331352 11362 FEE OVV P
LAZYK 2-14B3 14 020S 030W 4301331354 11452 FEE OW
MifFTHEVVS2-13B2 13 020S 020VV 4301331357 11374 FEE OVV P
LAKEFORK 3-15B4 15 020S 040W 4301331358 11378 FEE OW
STEVENSCHM3-29A3 29 010S 030VV 4301331376 11442 FEE CAN P
MEEKS3-883 08 020S 0300/ 4301331377 11489 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH3-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301331389 11488 FEE OVV P
DUNCAN5-13A2 13 010S 020VV 4301331516 11776 FEE CNV P
CAÑL3-17C5 17 030S 050VV 4301332112 12476 FEE OiN P
BROTHERSON2-24B4 24 020S 040?! 4301332695 14652 FEE O¾V P
BCH3RERO2-15B3 15 020S 030VV 4301332755 14750 FEE ONV P
BROTHERSON2-25B4 25 020S 040W 4301332791 15044 FEE OW P
CABINLAND2-1683 16 020S 030W 4301332914 15236 FEE OW P
KATHERINE 3-29B4 29 020S 040W 4301332923 15331 FEE OW P
SHRINERS2-10C5 10 030S 050W 4301333008 15908 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON2-26B4 26 020S 040W 4301333139 17047 FEE OW P
MORTENSEN 4-32A2 32 010S 020W 4301333211 15720 FEE OV\Ï
FERRARINI 3-2784 020S 040W 4301333265 15883 FEE OW P
RHOADES2-25B5 25 020S 050W 4301333467 16046 FEE OW P
CASE2-31B4 31 020S 040VV 4301333548 16225 FEE OVV P
ANDERSON-ROWLEY 2-24B3 2_4 020S 030W 4301333616 16284 FEE P
SPROUSE BOWDEN2-18B1 18 020S 010W 4301333808 16677 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 3-11B4 11 020S 040W 4301333904 16891 FEE OW
KOFFORD2-36B5 36 020S 050VV 4301333988 17048 FEE O\N P
ALLEN 3-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301334027 17166 FEE OW
BOURNAKIS3-18B4 18 020S 040VV 4301334091 17264 FEE |3f! P
MILES3-12B5 12 020S 050VV 4301334110 17316 FEE OVV P
OWL and HAWK 2-31B5 31 020S 050W 4301334123 17388 FEE OW P



El Paso E5 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E5 Company, LP. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

OWL and°HAWK 4-17C5 17 030S 050W 4301334193 17387 FEE OW P
DVVR3-32B5 32 020S 050VV 4301334207 17371 FEE C¾V P
LAKEFORKRANCH 3-2284 22 0208 040W 4301334261 17409 FEE OW P
HANSON3-9B3 09 020S 030VI 4301350065 17570 FEE OVV P
DYE2-28A1 28 010S 010VV 4301350066 17531 FEE O\¾ P
MEEKS3-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301350069 17605 FEE ONV P
HANSC‡J4-8B3 08 020S 030VV 4301350088 17571 FEE OVV rP C
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-14B4 14 020S 040W 4301350097 17484 FEE OW P
ALLEN 3-9B4 09 020S 040W 4TÕŒ55ÏžŠ17656 FEE W
HORROCKS4-20A1 20 010S 010W 4301350155 17916 FEE OW
HURLEY2-33A1 33 010S 010VV 4301350166 17573 FEE ONV P
HUTCHINS/CHIODO3-20C5 20 030S 050W 4301350190 17541 FEE OW
ALLEN3-8B4 08 020S 0409/ 4301350192 17622 FEE OVV P
OWILandHAVVK3-10C5 10 030S 050VV 4301350193 17532 FEE OMt P
ÒWÏ.and HAWK 3-19CS 19 030S 050W 4301350201 17508 FEE OW P
EL PASO 4-29B5 29 020S 050W 4301350208 17934 FEE OW C
DONIHUE3-20C6 20 030S 060VV 4301350270 17762 FEE OVV P
FUMMSON3-5B3 05 020S 030VV 4301350275 17725 FEE 04V P C
SPRATT 3-26B5 26 020S 050W 4301350302 17668 FEE OW P
REBEL3-35B5 35 020S 050VV 4301350388 17911 FEE O¾V P C
FREEMAN 4-1684 16 020S 040W 4301350438 17935 Fee OW P
VVILSON3-36B5 36 020S 050VV 4301350439 17936 Fee ONV P C
ELPASO3-21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301350474 18123 Fee 04V P C
IORIGat-12B3 12 020S 030VV 4301350487 17981 Fee O\N P C
CONOVER3-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301350526 18122 Fee OW P C
ROVVLEY3-16B4 16 020S 040VV 4301350569 18151 Fee OVV P C
POTTS 3-1483 14 020S 030W 4301350570 18366 Fee OW P C
FN3TTER4-27B5 27 020S 050VV 4301350571 99999 Fee CNV P C
EL PASO 4-21B4 21 020S 040W 4301350572 18152 Fee OW
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-26B4 26 020S 040W 4301350707 18270 Fee OW C
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-25B4 25 020S 040W 4301350711 18220 Fee OW P C
LAKEFK)RKFLANCH4-23B4 23 020S 040VV 4301350713 18271 Fee CNV P C
LAKEFORKRANCH4-15B4 15 020S 040VV 4301350715 18314 Fee OVV P C
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-24B4 24 020S 040W 4301350716 18269 Fee OW P C
GOLINSKI1-8C4 08 030S 040?! 4301350986 18301 Fee 04V P C
JFU3BERTSON 1-1B1 01 020S 01044 4304730174 5370 FEE C4V P
TIMOTiff1-8B1E 08 020S 010E 4304730215 1910 FEE OVV P
MAGDALENEPAPADOPULOS 1-34A1E 34 010S 010E 4304730241 785 FEE OW P
NELSON1-3tA1E 31 010S 010E 4304730671 830 FEE OVV P
ROSEMARY LLOYD1-24A1E 24 010S 010E 4304730707 840 FEE OW P
HD LANDY1-30A1E O 010S 010E 4304730790 845 FEE OW P
WALKER1-14A1E 14 010S 010E 4304730805 855 FEE OW P
BOLTON2-29A1E 29 010S 010E 4304731112 900 FEE OW P
PRESCCAT1-35Z1 kÏ 010N 010VV 4304731173 1425 FEE OVV P
BISEL GURR 11-1 11 010S 010W 4304731213 8438 FEE OW
UTETRIBAL2-22A1E 22 010S 010E 4304731265 915 FEE OVV P
L. BOLTON 1-12A1 12 010S 010W 4304731295 920 FEE OW P
FOWLES1-26A1 26 010S 010W 4304731296 930 FEE OVV
BRADLEY23-1 23 010S 010W 4304731297 8435 FEE OW P
BASTIAN 1-2A1 02 010S 010W 4304731373 Ì36 ËE ÃÏ
DR LONGž-15A1Ë i 010S 010E 4Š0ÀÌ314709ŠÕŒÏ ËË ÄÏ
DMCK3N1-23Z1 23 010N 010VV 4304731479 10310 FEE O\N P
O MOON 2-26Z1 26 010N 010W 4304731480 10135 FEE OW
LILAD2-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304731797 10790 FEE OVV P
LANDY2-30A1E 30 010S 010E 4304731895 11127 FEE OVV P
VVINNP2-3B1E 03 0206: 010E 4304732321 11428 FEE OiN P
BISEL-GURR 2-11A1 11 010S 010W 4304735410 14428 FEE OW P
FLYlNGJFEE2-12A1 12 010S 010VV 4304739467 16686 FEE OVV P



El Paso E6 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E6 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HARVEST FELLOWSHIP CHURCH2-14B1 020S 010W 4304739591 16546 FEE OW P
OBERHANSLY 3-11A1 _ 010S 010W 4304739679 17937 FEE OW
DUNCAN 2-34A1 34 010S 010W 4304739944 17043 FEE OW P
BISEL GURR 4-11A1 11 010S 010W 4304739961 16791 FEE OW
KILLIAN3-12A1 12 010S: 010VV 4304740226 17761 ML39760 O\N P
WAINOCO ST 1-1ÀB 020S 010W 4304730818 1420 ML-24306-A OW
UTAH ST UTE 1-35A1 35 010S 010W 4304730182 5520 ML-25432 OW
ST/VTE 1-19A4 19 0106; 040VV 4301330322 9118 ML-27912 OiN P
FEDERAL 2-28E19E 28 OSOS 190E 4304732849 12117 UTU-0143512 OW
FEDERAL 1-28E19E 28 050S 190E 4304730175 5680 UTU143512 O\¾ P
BLANCHARD 1-3A2 03 010S 020W 4301320316 5877 FEE OW PA
WH BLANCHARD 2-3A2 03 010S 020W 4301330008 5775 FEE OW PA
YACKU 1-7A1 07 010S 010VV 4301330018 5795 FEE OVV PA
JAAAESPOVVELL3 _ 13 010S 020VV 4301330024 8305 FEE VVD PA
BASTIAN1(3-7D) 07 010S 010VV 4301330026 5800 FEE OLV PA
LAMICQ-URRUTY 1-8A2 08 010S 020W 4301330036 5975 FEE OW_ PA
BLEAJJARD1-18B4 18 020S 040VV 4301330059 11262 FEE OVV PA
OLSEN 1-27A4 27 010S 040VV 4301330064 1565 FEE OVV F%4
EVANS 1-31A4 31 010S 040W 4301330067 5330 FEE OW
HAAABLIN1-26A2 26 010S 020VV 4301330083 2305 FEE OUV _F4
HARTMAN 1-31A3 31 010S 030W 4301330093 10700 FEE OW PA
FARNSWORTH1-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301330097 5725 FEE OW A
POVVELL1-33A3 33 010S 030VV 4301330105 4526 FEE OVV 44
LOTRIDGEGATES 1-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301330117 1625 FEE OW
REMINGTON 1-34A3 34 010S 030W 4301330139 1670 FEE OW
ANDERSON 1-28A2 28 010S 020W 4301330150 5895 FEE OW
RHOADESMOON 1-35B5 35 020S 050W 4301330155 5270 FEE OW PA
JC44N 1-3B2 03 020S 020VV 4301330160 5765 FEE O\N
SMITH 14C5 06 030S 050VV 4301330163 5385 FEE OVV F44
HORRCK3KSFEE 1-3A1 03 010S 010VV 4301330171 5505 FEE OVV !¾4
VVARREN1-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301330174 9139 FEE CAV PA
JENSENFENZEL1-20C5 20 030S 050VV 4301330177 4730 FEE ONV PA
MNTilNRANCH1-13B4 13 020S 040VV 4301330180 4524 FEE OVV PA
BFKITHERSON 1-27B4 27 020S 040VV 4301330185 1775 FEE OVV PA
JENSEN 1-31AS 31 010S 050VV 4301330186 4735 FEE OVV 144
ROBERTSON 1-29A2 29 010S 020W 4301330189 4740 FEE OW Ä
VVINKLER1-28A3 28 010S 030VV 4301330191 5465 FEE ONV PA
CHENEY1-33A2 33 010S 020VV 4301330202 1750 FEE O¾V 144
J LAMICQSTATE 1-681 06 020S 010W 4301330210 5730 FEE OW PA
REESEESTATE1-10B2 10 020S 020VV 4301330215 5700 FEE OlVV I¾\
REEDER1-17B5 17 020S 050VV 4301330218 5460 FEE O\N PA
ROBERTSONUTE 1-2B2 02 020S 020W 4301330225 1710 FEE OW A
HATCH1-5B1 05 020S 010VV 4301330226 5470 FEE OVV PA
BROTHERSON1-22B4 22 020S 040VV 4301330227 5935 FEE OVV PA
ALLRED1-16A3 16 010S 030VV 4301330232 1780 FEE OVV 144
BIRCH1-35A5 35 010S 0509/ 4301330233 9116 FEE OVV 4
MARQUERITEUTE 1-882 08 020S 020W 4301330235 9122 FEE OW A
BU22I1-11B2 11 020S 020VV4301330248 6335 FEE 01N 44
SHISLER 1-3B 03 020S 010VV4301330249 5960 FEE OW A
TEW 1-1B5 01 020S 050W 4301330264 5580 FEE OW Ã
EVANSUTE 1-19B3 020S 030W 4301330265 1870 FEE OW PA
SHELL2-27A4 N 010S 1040W 4301330266 1776 FEE WD PA
DYE1-29A1 29 010S 010VV 4301330271 99990 FEE OVV 144
\/ODAUTE 1-‡C5 0.4 030S 050VV4301330283 4530 FEE 09V PA
BROTHERSON 1-28A4 010S 040W 4301330292 9114 FEE OW PA
MEAGHER 1-4B2 04 020S 020W 4301330313 8402 FEE OW PA
NORLING 1-9B1 020S 010W 4301330315 1811 FEE OW Ä
S. BROADHEAD 1-9C5 09 030S 050W 4301330316 5940 FEE OW PA



El Paso E7 Company, LP. (N3065) to EP Energy E7 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

TIh&DTHY1-09A3 09 010S 030VV 4301330321 10883 FEE 04V PA
BARRETT 1-34A5 34 010S 050W 4301330323 9115 FEE OW PA
MEAGHER TRIBAL 1-9B2 09 020S 020W 4301330325 9121 FEE OW PA
PHILLIPSUTE 1-3C5 03 030S 050W 4301330333 1816 FEE OW PA
ELLSWIORTH1-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301330351 6375 FEE ONV PA
LAVVSC‡J1-28A1 28 010S 010VV 4301330358 5915 FEE OVV PA
An ES1-23A4 23 010S 040VV 4301330375 1901 FEE OVV PA
HORROCKS1-6A1 06 010S 010W 4301330390 5675 FEE OW PA
SHRINE HOSPITAL 1-10C5 10 0308 050W 4301330393 5565 FEE OW Pi
GOODRICH 1-1882 18 020S 020VV 4301330397 5485 FEE O\N PA
SVVDPOVVELL3 13 010S 020VV 4301330478 10708 FEE VVD PA
BODRERO1-15B3 15 020S 030W 4301330565 4534 FEE OW
AkOC‡4TRIBAL1-30C4 30 030S 040VV 4301330576 2360 FEE ONV PA
DUNCAN2-9B5 09 020S 050VV 4301330719 5440 FEE ONV PA
FISHER1-16A4 16 010S 040VV 4301330737 2410 FEE ONV PA
URRUTY2-34A2 34 010S 020VV 4301330753 9117 FEE ONV PA
GiOODRICH1-24A4 24 010S 040VV 4301330760 2415 FEE 04V PA
CARLSMITH2-25A4 25 0108 040VV 4301330776 9136 FEE 04V PA
ANDERSC‡J1-A30B1 30 020S 010VV 4301330783 9137 FEE OVV PA
CADILLAC3-6A1 06 010S 010W 4301330834 6316 FEE OW PA
MCELPRANG 2-31A1 31 010S 010W 4301330836 8439 FEE OW A
REESE ESTATE 2-10B2 10 020S 020W 4301330837 2417 FEE OW
CLARK2-9A3 09 010S 030W 4301330876 2416 FEE OW PA
JENKINS3-16A3 16 010S 030VV 4301330877 9790 FEE ONV PA
CHRISTENSEN2-26AS 26 010S 050VV 4301330905 10710 FEE ONV PA
FORD2-36A5 36 010S 050VV 4301330911 9630 FEE O¾V PA
MORTENSEN 2-32A2 32 010S 02OW 4301330929 9486 FEE OW PA
M/ILKERSON 1-20Z1 20 010N 010VV 4301330942 5452 FEE ONV PA
UTE TRIBAL 2-4A3 S 04 010S 030W 4301330950 10230 FEE OW
OBERHANSLY2-31Z1 31 010N 010VV 4301330970 9262 FEE Ï>Al I¾\
MORRIS2-TA3 07 010S 030VV 4301330977 9725 FEE ONV PA
POVVELL2-08A3 08 010S 030VV4301330979 10175 FEE OVV PA
FISHER24A3 06 010S 030VV 4301330984 10110 FEE OVV PA
JACOBSEN2-12A4 2 010S 040VV 4301330985 10480 FEE OVV PA
CHENEY2-33/G 33 010S 020VV 4301331042 10313 FEE OVV PA
HANSON TRUST 2-29A3 29 010S 030W 4301331043 5306 FEE OW PA
BURTON2-15B5 15 020S 050VV 4301331044 10205 FEE OVV PA
ËÃh4NS-UTE2-1783 17 020S 030VV 4301331056 10210 FEE LDVV PA
ELLSVVORTH2-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301331090 5336 FEE 04V !%4
REMINGTON 2-34A3 34 010S 030W 4301331091 1902 FEE OW PA
VVINKLER2-28A3 28 010S 030VV 4301331109 4519 FEE O\¾ PA
TEVV2-10B5 10 020S 050VV 4301331125 1751 FEE ONV PA
LIND6WAY2-33A4 33 010S 040VV 4301331141 1756 FEE OVV PA
FIELDSTED2-28A4 28 010S 040VV 4301331293 10665 FEE OVV PA
POWELL 4-13A2 13 010S 020W 4301331336 11177 FEE GW PA
DUMP2-20A3 20 010S 030W 4301331505 11691 FEE OW PA
SMITH2X-23C7 23 0308 070VV 4301331634 12382 FEE D PA
MORTENSEN 3-32A2 32 010S 020W 4301331872 11928 FEE OW PA
TODDUSA ST 1-2B1 02 020S 010W 4304730167 99998 FEE OW PA
STATE1-7B1E 07 020S 010E 4304730180 5555 FEE OW
BACON1-10B1E 10 020S 010E 4304730881 5550 FEE ONV PA
PARIETTEDRAW 28-44 28 040S 010E 4304731408 4537 FEE OW PA
REYNOLDS2-7B1E 07 020S 010E 4304731840 4960 FEE OW PA
STATE2-35A2 35 010S 020W 4301330156 4715 ML-22874 OW PA
UTAH STATE LB 1-11B1 11 020S 010W 4304730171 5530 ML-23655 OW PA
STATE1-8A3 08 010S 030W 4301330286 5655 ML-24316 OW A
UTAHFEDERAL1-24B1 24 020S 010W 4304730220 590 ML-26079 OW PA
CEDAR RIM 15 34 030S 060W 4301330383 6395 14-20-462- 29 OW S



El Paso E8 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E8 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE TRIBAL2-24C7 24 030S 070W 4301331028 10240 14-20-H62-1135 OW S
CEDARRIM12 28 030S 060W 4301330344 6370 14-20-H62-1323 OW IS
CEDARRIM16 33 030S 060W 4301330363 6390 14-20-H62-1328 OW S
SPRING HOLLOW 2-34Z3 34 010N 030W 4301330234 5255 14-20-H62-1480 OW S
E3/ANSUTE1-17B3 17 020S 030VV 4301330274 5335 14-20-H62-1733 OVV S
UTE JENKS 2-1-B4 G 01 020S 040W 4301331197 10844 14-20-H62-1782 OW S
LffE3-12B3 12 020S 030VV 4301331379 11490 14-20-H62-1810 OVV S
UTE TRIBAL9-4B1 04 020S 010W 4301330194 5715 14-20-H62-1969 OW S
UTE TRIBAL 2-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301331424 11615 14-20-H62-2489 OW S
UTE 1-33B6 33 020S 060W 4301330441 1230 14-20-H62-2493 OW S
UTE2-22B5 22 0206; 050VV 4301331122 10453 14-:20-H62-2509 O\N S
UTE1-1881E 18 020S 010E 4304730969 9135 14-20-H62-2864 O\¾ S
LAUREN UTE 1-23A3 23 010S 030W 4301330895 9403 14-20-H62-3981 OW S
UTE 2-28B6 28 020S 060W 4301331434 116i4 14-20-H62-4622 OW S
UTE 1-27B6X 27 020S 060W 4301330517 11166 14-20-H62-4631 OW S
UTE2-27B6 27 020S 060VV 4301331449 11660 14-20-H62-4:331 ONV S
CEDAR RIM10-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330328 6365 14-20-H62-4724 OW 5
UTE 5-30A2 30 010S 020W 4301330169 5910 14-20-H62-4863 OW S
UTE TRIBAL G-1 (1-24C6) 24 030S 060W 4301330298 4533 14-20-H62-4866 OW S
UTE TRIBAL FEDERAL 1-30C5 30 030S 050W 4301330475 665 14-20-H62-4876 OW S
SMB1-10A2 10 010S 020VV 4301330012 5865 FEE OVV S
KENDALL1-12A2 12 010S 020VV 4301330013 5875 FEE ONV S
CEDARRIM2 20 030S 060VV .4301330019 6315 FEE ONV S
URRUTY 2-9A2 09 010S 020W 4301330046 5855 FEE OW S
BROTHERSON 1-14B4

J¯
ÕžÕŠ040W

4301330Ò5
1̄535 FEE OW

RUST1-4B3 04 020S 030VV 4301330063 1575 FEE OVV S
WK3NSEN1-21A3 21 010S 030VV4301330082 1590 FEE O\¾ S
BFKITHERSCRM1-10B4 10 020S 040VV 4301330110 1614 FEE ONV S
FÄRNSWORTH 1-12B5 12 020S 050W 4301330124 1645 FEE OW 5
ELLSVIORTH1-16B4 16 020S 040VV .4301330192 1735 FEE ONV S
MARSHALL1-;K)A3 20 010S 030VV 4301330193 9340 FEE OVV S
CHRISTMAN BLAND 1-31B4 31 020S 040W 4301330198 4745 FEE M S
FK)PER1-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301330217 1850 FEE O\¾ S
EUROTHERSO‡l1-24B4 24 020S 040VV 4301330229 1865 FEE OVV S
BFMITHERSCRM1-33A4 33 010S 040VV 4301330272 1680 FEE ONV S
BROTHERSON 1-23B4 23 020S 040W 4301330483 8423 FEE OW S
SMITHALBERT2-8C5 08 030S 050VV 4301330543 5495 FEE OVV S
VODAJOSEPHINE2-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301330553 5650 FEE ONV S
HANSEN1-16B3 16 020S 030VV 4301330617 9124 FEE OVV S
BFMITHERSCR41-25B4 25 020S 040VV 4301330668 9126 FEE 04V S
POWELL 2-33A3 33 010S 030W 4301330704 2400 FEE OW S
BROWN2-28B5 28 020S 050W 4301330718 9131 FEE OW
EULA-UTE1-16A1 16 010S 010VV 4301330782 8443 FEE O\N S
JESSEN 1-15A4 15 010S 040VV 4301330817 9345 FEE ONV S
REK3USTON 1-22Z1 22 010N 010VV 4301330884 936 FEE 04V S
FIELDSTED 2-27A4 27 010S 040W 4301330915 9632 FEE OW S
HANSKUTT 2-23B5 _ 23 020S 050W 4301330917 9600 FEE OW S
TIMOTHY 4-18A3 18 010S 030W 4301330940 9633 FEE OW S
BFKITHERSON2-3B4 03 020S 040VV 4301331008 10165 FEE ONV S
BROTHERSON 2-22B4 22 020S 1040W 4301331086 1782 FEE OW S
MILES2-35A4 35 010S 040W 4301331087 1966 FEE OW S
ELLSWORTH 2-17B4 17 020S 040W 4301331089 1696 FEE OW
RUST 2-36A4 36 010S 040W 4301331092 1577 FEE OW S
E\h4NS2-19B3 19 020S 030VV 4301331113 1777 FEE OiN iS
FARNSWORTH 2-12BS 12 020S 050W 4301331115 1646 FEE OW S
CHRISTENSEN 3-4B4 04 020S 040W 4301331142 10481 FEE OW Š
ROBERTSON 2-29A2 29 010S 020W ¡430133115010679 , FEE OW S
CEDAR RIM2A näiÏW 4301331172 10671 E OW S



El Paso E9 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E9 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

HARTMAN 2-31A3 31 010S 030W 4301331243 11026 FEE OW S
GOODRICH 2-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301331246 11037 FEE OW 'S
JESSEN2-:21A4 21 0106; 040VV 4301331256 11061 FEE C\N S
BROTHERSON3-23B4 23 020S 040W 4301331289 11141 FEE OW S
MYRIN FDANCH2-18B3 18 020S 030VV 4301331297 11475 FEE CAN S
BROTHERSON2-2B5 02 020S 050W 4301331302 11342 FEE OW S
DASTRUP2-30A3 30 010S 030VV 4301331320 11253 FEE 04V S
YOUNK32-30B4 30 020S 040VV 4301331366 11453 FEE ONV S
lOFK32-10B3 10 020S 030VV 4301331388 11482 FEE OVV S
WK3NSEN3-27A3 27 010S 030VV 4301331401 11686 FEE O\¾ S
HORROC‡092-5B1E 05 020S 010E 4304732409 11481 FEE CAN S
I-4RSEN1-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304730552 815 FEE OVV TA
DRYGULCH1-36A1 36 010S 0100/ 4304730569 820 FEE ONV TA



RECEIVED: Apr. 08, 2013

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 LAKE FORK 2-13B4 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43013311340000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0819 FSL 0963 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWSW Section: 13 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

4 /8 /2013

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  Install new Rotoflex

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Disassemble old pumping unit and install new Rotoflex pumping unit.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038

TITLE
 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 4 /8 /2013

April 09, 2013

Sundry Number: 36607 API Well Number: 43013311340000Sundry Number: 36607 API Well Number: 43013311340000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well LAKE FORK 2-13B4

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY,L.P. 43013311340000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

0819 FSL 0963 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWSW Section: 13 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

4/8/2013
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENTREPORT DEEPEN FRACTURETREAT NEWCONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Install new Rotoflex

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Disassemble old pumping unit and install new Rotoflex pumping unit. Accepted by the
utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
April 09, 2013

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 4/8/2013

RECEIVED: Apr. 08,



RECEIVED: Apr. 26, 2013

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 LAKE FORK 2-13B4 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43013311340000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0819 FSL 0963 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWSW Section: 13 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

4 /12 /2013

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  Install new Rotoflex

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Installed new Rotoflex pumping unit.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038

TITLE
 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 4 /26 /2013

April 29, 2013

Sundry Number: 36986 API Well Number: 43013311340000Sundry Number: 36986 API Well Number: 43013311340000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well LAKE FORK 2-13B4

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY,L.P. 43013311340000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

0819 FSL 0963 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWSW Section: 13 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

4/12/2013
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Install new Rotoflex

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Installed new Rotoflex pumping unit. Accepted by the
utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
April 29, 2013

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 4/26/2013

RECEIVED: Apr. 26,
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