
ForrnOGC-la SUBMIT IN ,.
'LICATE*

STATE OF UTAH (Other instructions on
reverse side)

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

Fee

APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILL, DEEPEN, OR PLUG BACK 6. U Indian, Anottee or TrH>e Name

la. Type of Work
7. Unit Agreement Name

DRILL DEEPEN O PLUG BACK O
b. Type of Well

Oil Gas Single Multiple 8. Farm or Lease Name
Well Well Other Zone Zone

me of Operator Potter
Utex Oil Company 9. Well No.

3. Address of Operator . 2-24B5
1245 E. Brickyard Road, Suite 600, Salt Lake City, UT S4106 10.FieldandPool,orWildcat

4. ge ion of weli <aerort location ciearly and in secoraanee with any state r REGEIVE17¯¯VAl tamont

At proposed prod. zone
922' FWL 2,124' FSL ' °2

T2S R5W
JUL 05 1985 usM

14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parrish 13. State

7½ miles southwest of Altamont, Utah Duchesne Utah
15. Distance from proposed* 16; No. of acres in le e 17. No. of acres assigned

location to nearest GAS MlNING to this well
property or lease line, ft. gap g n
(Also to nearest drig. line, if any) Ivv U U ;

18. Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed depth 20. Rotary or cable tools
to nearest well, drilling, completed,
or avolied for, on this lease, ft. 13,200 Rotary

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 22. Approx. date work will start*

6,273' GR Jul y 16, 1985
21

PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

Size of Hole Size of Casing Weight per Foot Setting Depth Quantity of Cement

12¼" 9 5/8" 36# 4,500 : circulate to surface
8 3/4" 7" 26# 10,100 as necessary
6 1/8" 5" 18# 13,200 as necessary

Utex controls the land within 660' of the well location

CONRDENR
Water Permit # 43-95-87 is on file with the State of Utah

IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM: If proposal is to deepen or vlug back, give data on present productive zone and proposed new pro-

ductive zone. If proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give vertinent data on subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths. Give blowout
Sei

nl .. ................ Title.. . Date... ..

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY THE STATE

A ed by .... ................ it .........

pproval ...

*See Instructions On Regg
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9 O
UTEX OIL COMPANY

SUITE 600
1245 EAST BRICKYARD ROAD

SALT LAKE CFrY,UTAHM106

PHONE (801) 4-2262

July 2, 1985

State of Utah RECEIVED
Department of Natural Resources
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
355 West North Temple JUL 05 1985
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203 EUVUPON Ur CUL

GAS & tvlNINGi

Gentlemen:

Enclosed please find the following:

1. Triplicate copies of Application for Permit to Drill
the Potter 2-24B5 well, located in the NWh, SWh of Section
24, Township 2 South, Range 5 West, Duchesne County,
Utah.

2. Triplicate copies of survey plat.

3. Triplicate copies of well layout plat.

4. Triplicate copies of BOP drawing.

5. Triplicate copies of 10 Point Well Prognosis.

We trust this application is complete and in proper form
for your rapid approval of our planned operations. If further
information is required, please contact us at the above address
or telephone number.

We hereby request that this APD and all other information
submitted relative to this well be held confidential for the
maximumallowable period of time.

If I may be of further assistance, please advise.

Sincerely,

D. T. Hansen

DTH/mm
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LOCA N THE NW¾ OF THE SW¾ OF

U TEX O/L COh/PANY SECTION 24, T2S, RSW, U.S.B.&M.

WELL LOCAT/0H PLAT
POTTER 2-2485

N TH

24
POTTER 2- 2485
GROUND ELEV. 1273'

922' SCALE: l"=lOOO'

o
O

S 89°54' W 60.38 Chs.

LEGEND & NOTES SURVEYON'S CERT/E/CATE

CORNERS FOUND AND USED BY THIS SURVEY. I hereby certify that this plat was prepared
from field notes of an actual survey
performed by me, during which the shown

THE GENERAL LAND OFFICE PLAT WAS USED MORUMOftts were found or established.
FORE R ERENCE AEND CALCULATDI SERMINED

BY Je D. þilred,Registered Lan
SOLAR OBSERVATIONS. SUrveyof. Cert. No. 3817 (Utah)

JERRY D. ALLRED& ASSOCIATES

121 North Center Street
P.O. Drawer C

DUCHESNE, UTAH 8402179-121-086 19 June 1985
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(lik (Ill July 2, 1985

VED
UTEXOIL COMPANY

10 Point Well Prognosis
PCTTER2-2485 05 1985

1. Surface formation: TertiaSydsgigggggg¶mation

2. Estimated tops of geologic markers: Top Green River 4,550
Top Wasatch 10,340

3. Estimated depths to water, oil and gas or mineral bearing formations:

0-4,550 Uinta - Water bearing
4,250-10,340 Green River - Oil, Gas and Water

10,340 to T.D. Wasatch - Oil, Gas and Water

4. Casing program: Size Weight Grade Depth

9 5/8" 36# J-55 4,500'
7" 26# N-80 10,100'
5" 18# N-80 13,200'

5. Pressure control equipment: See diagram attached to APD.
Blowout preventers: A series 1500, 5000 psi W.P.
hydraulically operated double ram type preventer, with pipe and blind
rams, and a 5000 psi, Hydril type preventer will be used.
A 5,000 psi W.P. hydraulic choke manifold, PVT, and flow sensors will
be used.
Testing Procedure: Before drilling out each casing string, blowout pre-
venters, casing head, and casing will be pressure tested, and blowout
preventers will be checked for proper operation each day.

6. Type and characteristics of proposed circulating medium:
0-4,500 Fresh water with gel sweeps
4,500-10,100 Fresh gel mud lightly treated, water loss controlled

below 7,000'.
10,100-T.D. Fresh gel mud, weighted, treated and dispersed as

necessary.
Approximately 800 barrels of circulating fluid and
adequate bulk barite will be maintained on site.

7. Auxillary Equipment:
Upper and lower kelly cocks will be used, and a full opening valve will
be maintained on the rig floor. A mud logging unit is planned from
7,000' to total depth with 24 hour supervision.

8. Testing and Coring:
No DST's are planned
DIL with S.P. and G.R., FD-CN

9. Anticipated Hazards:
No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No hydrogen
sulfide is present in this area.

10. Anticipated starting date:
July 15, 1985 with duration of operations approximately 90
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O O

UTEX DRILLlNG CO.

BOP STACK

ROTARY TABLE KELLY(with lower kelly cock,5000 lbs.)

10 " 1500 SERIES 6" 1500 SERIES FL ANGE
ROTATING HEAD

ORBIT VALVE
BLOOlE LINE

N lO" 1500 SERIESPIPE RAMS
) SHAFFER

innininuinn""" DOU B LE - GATE
BLIND RAMS

3" KILL LINES 3" OPENING FOR CHOKE
SYSTEM, 5000 Ibs.

SERIES 1500 EOUlPMENT IS 5000 PSI RATED

NOT TO SCALE
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STATE OF UTAH
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

OIL AND GAS INSPECTION RECORD

PRESITE INSPECTION

OPERATORUtex Oil Co, LEASE Potter

WELL NO. - 2-24B5 API

Nw/SwSEC. 24 T. 2s R. Sw CONTRACTOR

COUNTYDuchesne FIELD Altamont

DRILLING/CONPLETION/WORKOVER:
APD WELLSIGN HOUSEKEEPING BOPE
SAFETY POLL. CONTROL SURFACEUSE PITS
OPERATIONS OTHER

¯ ¯¯

SHUT-IN / TA :
WELL SIGN HOUSEKEEPING EQUIPMENT* SAFETY
OTHER

ABANDONEO:
MARKER HOUSEKEEPING REHAB. OTHER

PRODUCTION:
WELLSIGN HOUSEKEEPING EQUIPMENT* FACILITIES*
METERING* POLL. CONTROL PITS DISPOSAL

¯

SECURITY SAFETY OTHER

GAS DISPOSITION:
VENTED/FLARED SOLD LEASE USE

LEGEND: Y - YES OR SATISFACTORY
N - NO OR UNSATISFACTORY
NA - NOT APPLICABLE

*FACILITIES INSPECTED:A presite inspection was made at this well on the 4th of June

by Jimmie Thompson and the dirt contractor for Utex Oil Co. The well location

has not been staked as of this date, the only flagging was the well b_ore location.

REMARKS: It was determined that the reserve pit should be located on the north

side of the location and it should be lined with bentonite.

ACTION:I redommend that there be a recheck inspection when the location and the reserve

pit is constructed.

INS3ECTOR: Jimmie Thompson DATE
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STATE OF UTAH
DIVISION OF OIL,-GAS AND MINING

OIL ANDGAS INSPECTION RECORD
PRE SITE INSPECTION

SPERATORUtex Oil Co. LEASE Potter-Fee
WELLNO. 2-24B5 API

SEC. 24 T. 2s R. Sw CONTRACTOR

COUNTY Duchesne FIELO Altamont

DRILLING/CONPLETION/WORKOVER:
AFD WELL SIGN HOUSEKEEPÏNG BCPE
SAFETY POLL. CONTROL SURFACEUSE PITS
CPERATIONS OTHER

SHUT-IN / TA :
ËEESIGN HOUSEKEEPING EDUIFMENT* SAFETY

¯¯¯¯¯

OTHER

ASANDONED:
MARKER HOUSEKEEPING REHAB. OTHER

FRODUCTION:
WELLSIGN HOUSEKEEPING EQUIPMENT* FACILITIES*
METERING* POLL. CONTROL PÏTS DISFOSAL
SECURITY = SAFETY OTHER

GAS DISFOSITION:
VENTED/FLARED SOLD LEASE USE

LEGEND: Y - YES OR SATISFACTORY
N - NO OR UNSATISFACTORY
NA - NOT APFLICABLE

*FACILITIES INSPECTED: Drilling site, access road and surrounding area, reserve pit
location. Inspection was made on June 4th, 1985 by Jim Thompson of the Diviäion
and Mr. John Fauest, dirt contractor for Utex Oil Co.

REMARKS:Reserve pit will be located on the south east corner of location.
Reserve pit should be lined with gel.

ACTION:

INEPECTOR: Jimmie Thompson DATE
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COMPAN Y LDCATED IN THE NWL OF THE SWh OF

SECTION 24, T2S, R5W, U.S.B.&M.
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/ = 50 STA. 2630 «cacerve err .

CUF
LOCAT/ON SÛ?FRACE

627/

/"= 50' S TA. 0·/-00

8
F/LL

QUANT/T/ES 75' i s'+sk

APPROX/MATE CUT·32, 600 Co. Yds.
KEYWAY A A

APPROX/MATE F/LL·6,700 Co. Yds.

JERRY D. ALLRED & ASSOCIATES
Surveying & Engineering Consultants

121 North Center Street
PO Drawer C

DUCHESNE UTAH 84021

E /985 79 - /2/-066 (801)
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SE BOUNDAR'.«' DESCR [PT s ro'az35'
2 74. 9/' 24

Beginning at a point which is North 29°28'54" East 2097.51 fact from the

Southwest Corner of Section 24, Township 2 South, Range 5 West of the

Gintah Special Base and Meridian;

Thence North 31° East 370 feet;

Thence North 59°West 560 feet;

Thence South 31°West 370 Feet;

Thence South 59°East 560 feet to the Point of Beginning, containing

4.76
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Southwest Corner of Section 24, Township 2 South, Range 5 West of the

Gintah Special Base and Meridian;

Thence North 31° East 370 feet;

Thence North 59°West 560 feet;

Thence South 31°West 370 Feet;

Thence South 59°East 560 feet to the Point of Beginning, containing

4.76



R/GHT 0E WAY AND USE BOUNDARY
PO T TER 2-2485

U TEX 0/L COMPAN Y

DESCRIPTION OF RIGHT-OF-WAY IN SECTTON 24

A 33 feet wide right.-of-way over part of Section 24, Township 2 South,

Range 5 West of the Eintah Special Base and Meridian, the centerline of

said right-of-way being further described as follows:

Beginning at a point on the South line of said section 24, said point being

c North 89°54' East 1504.98 feet from the Southwest Corner of said Section;

Thence North 5°3B'15" West 293.04 feet;

Thence North 0°07'39" East 292 feet;

Thence North 39°08'02" East 267.48 fact;

Thence North 22°43'36" East 245.51 feet;

Thence North 20°19'li" East 284.08 feet;

Thence North 150 feet;

Thence South 55°37'35" West 357.95 feet;

Thencr- North 27°34'35" West ß62 feet, more or less to the Utex Oil Company

PDTTER 2-2485 cil well location, containing 2.08 acres.

DESCRIPTION OF RIGHT-OF-WAY IN SECTION 25

A 33 feEt wide right-of-way over part of Section 25, Township 2 South,

Range 5 West of thc Uintah Special Base and Meridian, the centerline of

said ri ht-of-way being further described as follows:

Beginnity at a point on the North lino of said Section 25, said point being

Jurth 99°54'East l5û4.98 feet from the Northwest Corner of sairi
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Thence ícuth l?°00'37" East 246.35 feet;

Thence South 34°43'32" East 458.59 feet;

Thence South 48°3ß'52" East 294.40 feet;

Thence : outh 7°33'50" West 121.60 feet;

Thence South 50°42'24" East 173.21 fcet;

Thence South 5°56'25" East 38l.44 feet;

Thence South 39°41'24" East 87.20 feet;

Thence South 89°48'36" East 180.97 feet;

Thence Ecuth 62 '28" East 316.14 feet;

Thence douth 61°26'45" East 254.43 feet;

s..
Thenco South 70° 6'57" East 426.68 feet;

/A/24°41'4/'.E
Thence South G3°10'13" East 174.62 feet;

Thence South 74°56'25" East 135.92 feet;

V48 /2 '/S"£79o.¿y- Thence South 73°41'45" East 213.64 'eet;

Thence South 70°02'3 " East 274.91 feet;

o'/3'E
Jr Thence ::crth 3 14'46" East 250.69 feet;

Thencc North 15°20'13" East 386 .32 feet;

Thence North 48°12'15" East 190.29 feet;

Thence 3:orth 24°43'49" East 308.33 feet to an existing oil well location,

JERRY D. ALLRED & ASSOCIATES
Surveying & Engineering Consultants

121 North Center Street
P.O. Drawer C

DUCHESNE,UTAH84021

25 ax/r 'es 22 2 /¯ (801)
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O STATEOF UTAH Normon H. Bangerter, ëovernor
NATURALRESOURCES Dee c. Hansen, Executive Director

011, Gas & Mining Dianne R. Nielson, Ph.D., Division Director

355 W. North Temple•3 Triad Center• Suite 350 • Salt Lake City. UT84180-1203•801-538-5340

3uly 11, 1985

Utex Oil Company
1245 E. Brickyard Road, Suite 600
Salt Lake City, Utah 84106

Gentlemen:

Re: Well No. Potter 2-24BS - NWSW Sec. 24, T. 2S, R. 5W
2124' FSL, 922' FWL - Duchesne County, Utah

Approval to drill the above-referenced oil well is hereby granted in
accordance with the Order of Cause No. 139-42 dated April 17, 1985 subject to
the following stipulations:

1. Reserve pit shall be lined with bentonite at a concentration of 2-3
pounds per square inch.

In addition, the following actions are necessary to fully comply with
this approval:

1. Spudding notification to the Division within 24 hours after drilling
operations commence.

2. Submittal to the Division of completed Form OGC-8-X, Report of Water
Encountered During Drîlling.

3. Prompt notification to the Division should you determine that it is
necessary to plug and abandon this well. Notify 3ohn R. Baza,
Petroleum Engineer, (Office) (801) 538-5340, (Home) 298-7695, or
R. 3. Firth, Associate Director, (Home) 571-6068.

4. Compliance with the requirements and regulations of Rule C-27,
Associated Gas Flaring, General Rules and Regulations, Oil and Gas
Conservation.

on equal opportunity
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Page 2
Utex Oil Company
Well No. Potter 2-24B5
3uly 11, 1985

5. This approval shall expire one (1) year after date of issuance unless
substantial and continuous operation is underway or an application
for an extensîon is made prior to the approval expiration date.

The API number assigned to this well is 43-013-31118.

Sincerely,

Associate Director, Oil & Gas

as
Enclosures
cc: Branch of Fluid
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DIVISIONOFOIL,GASANDMINING

SPUDDINGINFORMATIONAPI #43-013-31118

NAFEOFCfFPANY: UTEX OIL COMPANY

WFli NAME: POTTFP 7-7 5

SECTION Nw sw 24 TOWNSHIP 78 ÑANGE sy COUNTY nnene no

DRILLINGCONTRACTORHardrock Rat Hole

RIG#
SPUDDED:DATE 8-5-85

IIME 4:00 PM

ÑOW Rat Hole Digger

DRILLINGWILLCOMMENCE Utex nrilling - #1

REPORTEDBY Connie

TELEPHONE# 738-5798

DATE 8-s-ss SIGNED

DIVISIONOFOIL,GASANDMINING

SPUDDINGINFORMATIONAPI #43-013-31118

NAFEOFCfFPANY: UTEX OIL COMPANY

WFli NAME: POTTFP 7-7 5
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DRILLINGCONTRACTORHardrock Rat Hole
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IIME 4:00 PM
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REPORTEDBY Connie
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DATE 8-s-ss SIGNED



ATE OF UIAH '""
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 6- 'raar om.,anarson suo ,,,,as so.

Fee
5. ir INDIAN, ALLOTTES Og Talag NAMESUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSom¾SIVED(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

1.
OIL GAS

7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

WELL WELL OTHEE

2. NARB OF OPERATOR 8. TARM OE LEASE NAMS
Olvistuis ut OILUTEX OIL COMPANY POTTERa. anossa. or or=aarom CAO& MINING a. ,,,... ...

Suite 600, 1245 East Rrickyard Road, SLC, Utah 84106 2-24B_5
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.• 10. FIELD AND POOL, 08 WILDCATSee also space 17 below.)at sana**

Altamont
11. sme, T., a., x., on st.x. xxo

SURVET OR ARRA922' FWL 2,124' FSL

Sec. 24 T2S R5W USM
14. rzantT No. 18. aLavATIONa (Show whether or, at, on, sta.) 12.LUNTY os raaras 18. sTara

43-013-3118 6,973' op Duchesne I ntah
ze· CheckAppropnete BoxTo indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: BUBBBQUXKT EEPORT 07:

TEST WATžE BRUT-Orr PUI.L OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT•Orr REPAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOUTINC OR ACIDizlNO ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CIIANGE PLANs (Other)
DrillinÑ¯

(NOTE : Report results of multiple completion on Well(Other)
('ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DEscaint rHoynSED OR CUM1'I.ETF.D OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting anyproposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-nons to this work.) •

SPUDDED WELL AT 10:00 P.M. ON AUGUST 24, 1985

August 25, 1985 through August 31, 1985
Drilled from 0 to 3,200' in the Uintah formation

September 1, 1985 through September 7, 1985
Drilled from 3,200' to 5,395' in the Uintah formation , Ran 115 joints 9 5/8"

casing, cemented.
September 8, 1985 through September 14, 1985
Drilled from 5,395' to 7,902' in the Green River formation

September 15, 1985 through September 21, 1985
Drilled from 7,902' to 9,397' in the Green River formation

September 22, 1985 through September 28, 1985
Drilled from 9,397' to 10,475' in the Green River formation

September 29, 1985 through October 5, 1985
Drilled from 10,475' to 10,750' in the Wasatch formation
Ran 247 joints of 7" 26# casing, cemented.

Page 1
18. I hereby cr thai the forego n; is e and correct

SIGNE • - TITLE DATE

(This space for Federal or State othee use)

APF" VED gy TITLE DATE
CO.wn. IS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse
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Page 1
18. I hereby cr thai the forego n; is e and correct

SIGNE • - TITLE DATE

(This space for Federal or State othee use)

APF" VED gy TITLE DATE
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E OF UTAH ""
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 6. LEASE DESIGNATION .tND BERIAL NO.

Fee

SUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS
6. 17 INDiaN, ALLOTTER On TalmE NAMS

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different.reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PSRMIT-" for such proposals.)

1. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
OIL GABLL

OTHER
2. NAME OF OPERATOR e FARM OR LSABE NAME

Utex Oil Company POTTER
3. ADDREES OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

Suite 600, 1245 East Brickyard Roatj, Salt Lake City, Utah 84106 2-24B5
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.• 10. rtBLD AND POOL, 08 WILDCATSee also space 17 below.)

It surtae• Altamont
11. sme., T., z., M., om at.x. AND

80BV3T OR ASEA922' FWL 2,124' FSL
Sec. 24 T2S R5W USM

14. PERMIT No. 15, BLEVATIONa (Show whether er, ar, an, etc.) 12. CouNTY om raaras 18. stata
43-013-3118 6,273' GR Duchesne Utah

te· CheckAppropnate BoxTo Indicate Nature of Notics, Report,or OtherData
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: sussaqUENT REPORT OF:

TERT WATER BEUT•Orr PUT.L OR ALTzit CASING WATER SHUT•Orr REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CAalNG

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOUTING OR ACIDizlNO ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PI.ANS (Other) ÛÑËÎHg
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel(Other)

-...... ('ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)
17. DEsening rnOPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONs (Cle:irly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this work.) *

October 6, 1985 through October 12, 1985
Drilled from 10 , 750 ' to 11, 318 ' in the Wasatch formation

October 13, 1985 through October 19, 1985
Drilled from 11,318' to 12,030' in the Wasatch formation RECEIVED
October 20, 1985 through October 26, 1985
Drilled from12,030' to 12,910' in the Wasatch formation NOV271985

October 27, 1985 through November 2, 1985 OlVibiaN OF OIL
Drilled from 12,910' to 13,200' in the Wasatch formation GAS&MININGT.D. 13,200' on October 29, 1985
Ran 72 joints of 5" 18# casing, cemented.

RIG RELEASED AT 8:01 A.M. ON NOVEMBER 2, 1985

PAGE 2 CONFilENTlä

(This space for Federal or State ofice use)

APP"ovED BT TITLE DATE
Conun.. US OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

See Instructionson Revers.
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(This space for Federal or State ofice use)

APP"ovED BT TITLE DATE
Conun.. US OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

See Instructionson Revers.



L - REC
' REC

Form OGC-3
SUBMIT IN D 56 64 01

e -
" STATE OF H (See other instruc

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND BERIAL 0.

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETIONREPORTÂ LMINO N/Ala. ÏTPË O¥ WELL: o:L (,as
WELL WFLL DET Other 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF COMPLETION: N/A
2"=9 ."r°=a," O REP- O MO n'.'u.O ots., s. ra== •= -

2. NAME OF OPERATOR Ÿ0tter
UTEXOIL COMPANY O. WELL NO.

3. ADDRESE OF OPERATOR 2-2485
1245 E. Brickyard Rd., Ste. 600, Salt Lake City, Utah 84106 10. FIELD AND POOL, 08 WILDCAT

4, LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordanc¢ oith any State equirements)• RUÛ
at .unae* 922' FWL; 2,124' FSL Ã] SC u. SEC., T., E., M., OR BLOCK ANDBURVEY

At top prod. interval reported below 00NFllENTIAL°^

At total depth Sec. 24, T2S, R5W, USM
14. PER3tlT NO• DATE 18SEED 12. COUNTT ÕR 13. STATE

PARISH43-013-31118 7/11/85 Duchesne Utah
15. DATE SPCDDED 16. DATE T.D, REACHED 1Î. DATE COMPL. (Ready to prod.) 18. ELEVATIQNS (DF. REB, RT, GE, ETC•)e 19. ELET. CABINGHEAD

8/24/85 i 10/29/85 11/19/85 6,273' GR 6,273'
20. T&rAL DEFTH. MD A TVD SI. PLUO, BACK T.D.. MD A TVD 22. IF MULTIPLE COMPL., 23 INTERVALS ROTART TOOLS CABLE TOOLS
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PERFORATIONS

POTTER 2-24B5 DIVÑ¾Lua

10,808-10 2 11,460-62 2 12,159-61 2

10,899-901 2 11,505-07 2 12,179-81 2

10,933-35 2 11,548-50 2 12,191-93 2

10,940-42 2 11,553-54 1 12,226-28 2

10,978-80 2 11,598-600 2 12,235-37 2

10,996-98 2 11,623-25 2 12,272-76 4

11,007-09 2 11,630-32 2 12,345-47 2

11,026-27 1 11,634-36 2 12,381-83 2

11,034-36 2 11,645-47 2 12,429-31 2

11,105-07 2 11,666-67 1 12,472-74 2

11,111-13 2 11,674-75 2 12,495-97 2

11,120-21 1 11,760-62 2 12,550-53 2

11,149-51 2 11,781-83 2 12,567-70 3

11,169-71 2 11,807-09 2 12,579-80 1

11,183-85 2 11,826-28 2 12,657-59 2

11,215-18 3 11,870-71 1 12,716-18 2

11,242-43 1 11,879-81 2 12,764-65 1

11,267-69 2 11,900-02 2 12,775-78 3

11,291-93 2 11,934-36 2 12,798-800 2

11,326-27 1 11,962-64 2 12,860-62 2

11,345-46 1 11,978-81 3 12,878-80 2

11,352-54 ) 12,049-51 2 13,013-15 2

11,361-63 2 12,073-75 2 13,077-79 2

11,411-13 2 12,106-08 2 13,131-34 3

11,418-20 2 12,119-21 2

11,447-49 2 12,146-48 2

77 Zones
149'
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rorm utsL-iD SUU.\llT IN 1lill'LICATE*
TE OF UTAH (Other structions on

side)DEPARTMEN NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION O IL, GAS, AND MINING 6. LEASE DEsloNATION AND SERIAL NO,

FEE
SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plut back to a different reservoir.Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals.) N/A
1• Î. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

LL OX °w^.'rr. O .2..= N/A
2. Maxa or orzaaroa 8. TARM OR LEABE NAME

UTEX OIL COMPANY Potter
S. Anozzas or oramazon 9. waLr. No.

1245 E. Brickyard Rd., Ste. 600, Salt Lake City, Utah 84106 2-2485
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.• 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCATSee also space 17 below.)

At surface AÎ ÌñmOnt
11. asc., t., a., x., on ar,x. Ann

922' FWL 2,124' FSL °°"°¯

Sec. 24, T2S, R5W, USM
14. PERMIT NO. ii. ELEVATloNs (Show whether Dr, RT, on, ete.) 12. CoDMor ca FAalau 18. sTATa

43-013-31118 6,273' GR Duchesne Utah
ze· CheckAppropnote Box To indicate Natureof Notice, Report, or Other Data

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: BUmgaqUENT REPOET ON:

TEST WATEE RECT-OFF PUI.L OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT•OFF RETAIKING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIES ABANDON* SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONhfENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANs (Other)
(Other) IRStal 3ydraulic Pump XK mor=: Report mutta of =uittrie co=pieue= on wel

('umpletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)
17. DEBCRIDE PROPOSED OR 00Ml'LETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If well is distetionally drilled. give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pert!-
nent to this work.) *

A workover procedure is proposed to install a hydraulic pump
in the above well. This work will be performed when the well
ceases to flow.

18. I hereby cert at ue a correct

BIGNED TITLE O St , , 6/2/86

(This space for Federal or State ofBee use)

APPROVED BT TITLE n /\TECONDITIONS OF APPROVAI, IF ANY:

e ÎnstruCfÍOns



gg TotalMinatome Corporation -

OILANDGAS
June 3, 1988

DRN RJF

JRB GUd

DTs st.s GiL,GAS&M NO

Re: CSX Oil & Gas Corporation
( formerly Texas Gas
Exploration Corporation)
TOTAL MINATOME CORPCRATION
(formerly MinatomeLD-FILE Corporation) Merger

Gentlemen:

Please note that effective April 27, 1988 CSX Oil & Gas
Corporation ("CSX") merged into TOTAL MINATOME CORPORATION ("TMC");
and TMC is the surviving entity.

Please note that TMC is now responsible for payments
previously handled by CSX.

Please forward all invoices for what was formerly CSX goods
and services only to the following address:

TOTAL MINATOME CORPORATION
2 Houston Center,.Suite 2000 •

. 909 Fannin .
P. O. Box 4326
Houston, Texas 77210-4326

If you are currently sending invoices of any kind to TMC,
these should continue to be forwarded to the address you are
presently using.

Should you require any further assistance, please notify
Edward C. Huey, telephone number (713) 739-3150.

. Sincerely,

TOTAL MINATOME CORPORATION

By:
8 efre L fort
Vice President, Finance
and Administration

PL/ECH/sj

2 Houston Center, Suite 2000 • P.O. Box 4326 • Houston, Texas 77210-4326
Telephone (713) 739-3000 • Telecopler (713) 739-3160 • Telex
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¢Il eill

Operator: CSX Oil & Gas Corporation
County: Duchesne
State: Utah

UNIT/WELLNO_. FIELD LEASE fly
Broadhead 2-32B5 Altamont Fee Z~67

Burton 2-15B5 Altamont Indian/Fee (CA 96-46) (3 3/t

Duncan 2-985 Altamont Fee 95 /3- Sc7/? 2 5 5 fc
Evans 2-1983 Altamont Indian/Fee (CA 96-78) gy 3///3 i

Hall 2-24B2 P&A'd August, 1987 Indian/State/Fee 43- /
(CA UTO80I-85C75)

Hanskutt 2-23BS Altamont Fee '/34/3-52 , 2656

Lamicque 2-5B2 Bluebell Indian/Fee (CA 96-83) 3-0/3

Potter 2-24B5 Altamont Fee Ÿ3-ci3-3//lg 25 § 2

Reese Estate 2-10B2 Bluebell Fee gro/3 3e f.97 26 2
Pot

Rust 3-4B3 Altamont/Bluebell Fee $34/3-3/p 5 34

Smith 1-14CS Altamont Indian/Fee (CA UT-080I49-87C694) 3,c/3

Tew 2-1085 Altamont Indian/Fee (CA 96-54)(z.c/3-5//p6 95

Ute 2-2285 Altamont/Bluebell Indian (Lease #14-20-H62-2509)¾ci3-di

Ute Tribal 2-34A4 Altamont/Bluebell Indian/State/Fee (CA 96-40) / 6

(Lease No. 14-20-H62-1774) yst/3-3c'/72

Note: CA - Applicable Communitization Agreement

¢Il eill
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DOGMForm 5
MA'$. 1987

ATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING i. a.saan osasonarson ano esaus, no.

Pee

SUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a diferent reservoir.Use "APP1JCATION FOR PERMIT-" for each proposals.)

A. T. unrT AeasamswT masa
OIL OAS
WELL WELL OTESS

A. sama or orasseos s. FARM 08 LBABB NAME

TOTAL MINATOME CORPORATION POTTER
I. Annasas or orsastos a. wsz.r. no.

2 Houston Center, Suite 2000, Houston, TX 77210 #2-24B5
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location AÍearlyand in accordance with 487 Štate requirements.* 10. Flat.D AND 200(,, og WN.DCAT

See also space 17 below.)at aartae. Alt amont /Bluebell
11. eso., s., a., x., os sLE. Axa

922' FWL & 2124' FSL
soavar on assa

Sec 24-T2S-R5W
14•AP1 NUMSER li. BißTArt0NS ($how w ether DF, BT, om,ste.) 1$. COUNTT 08 FAalax iŠ. STATE

Permit #43-013-31118 6273 GR Duchesne Utah
le• OleckAppropnote BoxToindicate Natureof Notice, Reportsor Ôther0000

worrca or Irrameron so: sussaousse assors or:

TEST WATSB SECT<>FF PULL 08 ALTER CA3tNO WATSB SHUT<>rr REFAlala0 WEE.L

PRACTURE TREAT MCLTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TasATxxNT ALTERINO CAg!Ne

SMOOT OR ACIDiss X aaANDON* SBOUTING OR ACIDI32NO ASANDONMENT*

sarArs wat.L cuanos Pt.Ana (Other)
(tfors: Report reenits at multiple completion om Wel(Other) ('umpletion or RecomµIetina Report and Log form.)

17. exacatac rBOPosKO OR CUMl'LETED OPERATIOma (Clenriy state nil pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including esttaated date at starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertteal depths for all markers and semes perti-
nent to this work.) •

Proposal:

1. Move in & rig up service rig.
2. Pull 2-3/8" & 2-7/8" tubing and BHA.
3. Drill out 5" packer @ 10,360'.
4. Clean out 5" liner to 12,550'.
5. Set Bridge Plug at 12,400' w/2 sxs cmt on top.
6. Perforate additional infill Wasatch perforations as per attachment.
7. Run packer & acidize Wasatch zone with 25,000 gals. 15% acid.
8. Run production tubing and return well to production.

18. I aprobycertify that the foregoing is true d

BIGNED (A4ËÍË TIng Manaagr Productiop Oper. nays 07/18/88

(This space for Federal or State osce ase)

APPROVED BT TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAls 17 ANT: HE STATE

OF UTAH DIVISION OF
L GAS, AND MINING*S., instruenonson itevers.
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APPROVED BT TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAls 17 ANT: HE STATE
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RE: Workover Recommendation - Potter 2-2485

Set 5"-18# Bridge Plug on wire line at 12,400'. Dump 2 sxs cement
on top of plug with dump bailer. .

Perforate additional infill zones as follows -¿3 shots per foot,
note pressure change, if any:

12,352-356' - 4' 11,434-436' - 2'
12,308-311' - 3' 11,428-430' - 2"
12,283-286' - 3' 11,099-100' - l'
12,198-200' - 2' 11,092-093' - l'
12,128-130' - 2' 10,862-866' - 4'
12,088-090' - 2' 10,846-848' - 2'
11,988-992' - 4' 10,833-435' - 2'
11,922-924' - 2' 10,825-827' - 2'
11,854-855' - l' 10,801-803' - 2'
11,793-794' - l' 10,796-798' - 2'
11,656-658' - 2' 10,775-777' - 2'
11,513-515' - 2' 10,766-768' - 2'
11,476-479' - 3' 10,748-751' - 3'
11,472-473' - 1' 10,890-894' - 4'

28 zones - 63 feet
189
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Oil & Gas Company

P.O. Box X, Vernal, Utab 84078, Telephone (801) 789-0790

DEC091986
December 8 , 1986

OMSION OFOIL GAS&MINING

Utah Natural Resources
Oil, Gas & Mining
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Ut 84180-1203

Dear Sir,

We have assumed operation of the following wells from Utex Oil Co.

December 1, 1986.

77/ Lamicci.2-5B2 #Avel,

y Reesel 4Bate 2-10B2

yy Rust 3-4B3 /4 ¿'474
3///3 Evans 2-19BS gy /py
gy/fy few 2-10BG s /ld'&

J/ç gg' Burton 2-15B5 ggy
,y/µg Ute 2-22B5 /p¥ff

Jd f/7 .

Hanskutt 2-23B5 ZA#Æ
pq pp g Potter 2-24BS g¿zg¿

/d,yg Broadhead 2-32B5 & M.
Jo?Sp Smith 1-14CS /47 #f .

I understand we initially need to report these on your "Producing

Entity Action" form. Would you please send some of these forms for
reporting these wells next month. Would you also advise me which action

code to use. Thank you for your help in advance.

Sincerely,

Carol Hatch
Production Clerk N \

Part of the Enron Group of Energy

Oil & Gas Company

P.O. Box X, Vernal, Utab 84078, Telephone (801) 789-0790

DEC091986
December 8 , 1986

OMSION OFOIL GAS&MINING

Utah Natural Resources
Oil, Gas & Mining
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Ut 84180-1203

Dear Sir,

We have assumed operation of the following wells from Utex Oil Co.

December 1, 1986.

77/ Lamicci.2-5B2 #Avel,

y Reesel 4Bate 2-10B2

yy Rust 3-4B3 /4 ¿'474
3///3 Evans 2-19BS gy /py
gy/fy few 2-10BG s /ld'&

J/ç gg' Burton 2-15B5 ggy
,y/µg Ute 2-22B5 /p¥ff

Jd f/7 .

Hanskutt 2-23B5 ZA#Æ
pq pp g Potter 2-24BS g¿zg¿

/d,yg Broadhead 2-32B5 & M.
Jo?Sp Smith 1-14CS /47 #f .

I understand we initially need to report these on your "Producing

Entity Action" form. Would you please send some of these forms for
reporting these wells next month. Would you also advise me which action

code to use. Thank you for your help in advance.

Sincerely,

Carol Hatch
Production Clerk N \

Part of the Enron Group of Energy



' Form OGC-lb SUBMITIN TIUPLICATE*
S E OF UTAH (Othe tions on

DEPARTMENT ..,r NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING Ë. LBASE DBBIONaioN AWD BBBIAI NO.

Fee

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not use this term for pronosals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a (IRerent reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for ameb proposals.)
1. ¶. UNIT AGREBMENT WAME

W LL ELL O . ..

2. masa or orsaatos 8. raan om LBABB NAME

.Enron Oil & Gas Co. Potter
6. Annassa or orannom e. was.r. no.

P. O. Box 1815, Vernal, Utah 84078 2-2485
4. LOCATION Or WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any $tate requirementa.* 10. FIELD AND POOL, 08 Wil.DCAT

See also space 17 below.)
At sortaee Altamont

11. esc., T., B., M., OR BLE. AND

922' FWL 2,124 FSL
Se

.m27,

S, R5W

14. PaaMIT No. 15. ELEVArrows (8bow whether er, ar, en, ete.) 18, couarr om FAalsa fi. BTats

43-013-31118 6,273' GR Duchesne Utah

te CheckAppropnate BoxTo indicate Natureof Notice,Aeport,or Other Data
norren or surantron wo: avaamquant aaroar or:

TEST WATER BEUT•Orr PUI,L OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT•OFF REPAIRINO WELL

PRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CAglNO

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* BBOUTING OR ACIDIEING ABANDOMMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLAna (Other)
(NoTE : Report results of multiple completion on Wel(Other) Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DEBORIBE PROPOSED OR CUMPLETED OPERATIONS (Cl€ntly State all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled. give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this work.)•

ENRON OIL & GAS CO. (formerly Belco Development, Belnorth Pet. or HNG Oil Co.)

has assumed operation of this lease effective December 1, 1986 from Utex Oil Co.

18. I hpreby r the egoing is true and correct

SIGNED TITLE District Superintendent Data
12-8--86

(This space for Federal or State omce use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*Seelustructionson Reverse

' Form OGC-lb SUBMITIN TIUPLICATE*

S E OF UTAH (Othe tions on

DEPARTMENT ..,r NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING Ë. LBASE DBBIONaioN AWD BBBIAI NO.

Fee

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not use this term for pronosals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a (IRerent reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for ameb proposals.)
1. ¶. UNIT AGREBMENT WAME

W LL ELL O . ..
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.Enron Oil & Gas Co. Potter
6. Annassa or orannom e. was.r. no.
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(This space for Federal or State omce use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*Seelustructionson Reverse



ENRON 110917
Oil & Gas Company

P.O. Box 1815 Vernal, UT,84078 (801) 789-0790

November 2, 1987

Utah Natural Resource
Oil, Gas & Mining

355 West North Temple
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Ut 84180-1203

Dear Sirs,

This is to notify you that effective November 1, 1987 Enron's interest was
purbhased by CSX Oil y Gas Corporation, 410 Seventeenth St., Suite 300, Denver,
Colorado 80202 in the wells listed below. Actual operation of said wells by CSX
began November 1, 1987.

S-o/3-3/ d3 BROADHEAD 2-32B5 $ $ 6 g..) St.d. 39
An VSais-3/or/¥ BURTON 2-15B5 75 54> ac. /5
470 6-c/3-Sc7/g DUNCAN 2-985 2.,5 g(4) Syp, 9

Pora 45-0/3- 5///3 EVANS 2-19B3, 25 SA) EC. /Ÿ
A A3 013· 307 HALL g-24B2 ( þ 2d SM. >Ÿ

S_.-OLS-3VS~7 REESE E$TATE 2-10B2

N Ÿ0tà Ÿ3-o/3-3dŸ78 UTE TR1BAL 2-34A4 / S t.D Sr.C'. 9
Enron will be reporting production and disposition for the month of

September. These wells will be eliminated from Enron's produciton and disposition
report for October. If you have any questions please contact CSX at 303-825-8344.

Sincerely,

Carol Hatch
Production Analyst

cc: D. Wright
CSX

NOV 4 1987

Part of the Enron Group of Energy
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an equal oppor un e p y

F UTAH
NATURALRESOURCS
On, Gas & Mintog

355 West North Temple, 3 Triad Center, Suite 350, Salt Lake City, Ut
84180-1203.O(801-538-5340) Page--of

MONTHLY OlL AND GAS PRODUCTION REPORT

Operator name and address:

*CSX OIL & GAS CORP Utah Account No. NGO20
P 0 BOX 4326
HOUSTON TX 77010 4326 Report Period (Month/Year) 6

Amended Report

Wet! Name Producing Days Production Volume
API Number Entity Location Zone Oper Oil (BBL) Gas (MSCF) Water (BBL)

RUST #3-483
4301331070 01576 025 03w 4 wsTC
POTTER #2-2485
4301331118 01731 025 oSW 24 wsTC
TEW 2-1085
4301331125 01756 02S 05W 10 wsTC
EVANS #2-1983
4301331113 01777 02S 03W 19 wsTC
LAMICQ2-582
4301330784 02302 025 02W 5 wsTC
2-985
4301330719 02410 02S 05W 9 WSTC

SKUTT 2-23BS
4301330917 09600 02S 05W 23 wsTC
UTE 2.-34A-4
4301330978 10070 ois 04W 34 wsTC
BURTON #2-1585
4301331044 10210 02S 05W 15 WSTc
BROADHEAD #2-32BS
4301331036 10216 02S 05W 32 wsTC
UTE $2-2285
4301331122 10453 02S 05W 22 wsTC

TOTAL

Comments (attach separate sheet if necessary)

I have reviewed this report and certify the information to be accurate and complete. Date

TelephoneÃuthorizedsignature

PLEASE COMPLETE FORMS IN BLACK

an equal oppor un e p y
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SX OIL & GA5 CORPORATION

O GAS 2HoustonCenter,Suite2000
909 Fonnin • P.O. BorÄ326
Houston, Texas 77210-4326
(713) 739-3000

January 20, 1988

State of Utah
Department of Natural Resources (g/
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Suite 350, 3 Triad Center jþQA261988
355 West North Temple
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203 DIVEIONOF

DiL,ßAS&MUNG

Gentlemen: e

Effective August 1, 1987, CSX Oil & Gas Corporation purchased Enron Oil & Gas
Company's interest in several wells located in the State of Utah. (See
attached list). Actual operation of these wells by CSX Oil & Gas Corpora-
tion began on November 1, 1987.

As the new operator of wells located in the State of Utah, GSX Oil & Gas
Corporation herewith submits Form DOGM-2(Blanket Bond in the amount of
$80,000.00) to cover CSX Oil & Gas Corporation's oil and gas activities
within the State of Utah. Please advise if other bonds or information is
required by your office and/or the Utah Division of State Lands & Forestry.

For your information, CSXOil & Gas Corporation has an approved Collective
Bond ($75,000) on file with the Bureau of Indian Affairs.

Should you require additional documents or have questions conerning the
enclosed bond, please call Mr. Gary Birdwell at (713) 739-3000. Thank you.

Sincerely yours,

S CORP

Patricia A. Rygg
Consulting Regulatory Agent

PAR/me
Enclosures

xc: CSXOil & Gas Corporation
410 Seventeenth St., Suite 300
Denver, Colorado 80202
ATTN: Mr. Gene
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O O
Forrn OGCC-1 be

ST A TE OF UT A H SIIBMIT IN TRIPLICATE*
(Other instructions on re-
verse side) 6. LEASE DESIONATION AND BERIAL NO.

OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION Fee
6. IF SDIAN, AL Ei OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRYNOTlŒS AND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposais.)

1. Î. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

OIL GAS
WELL WELL OTHEE

2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FARM OL LEASE NAME

Total Miriatome Corporation Potter
8. ADDREsa OF OPREATOR 9. WELL NO.

P. O. Box 4326 Houston, Texas 77210-4326 #2-24B5
4. LOCATION OF WELL (RBþOrt IOcation clearly and in accordance with any State requirernents.• 10, rlËLD AÄnËœi, OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
at surface Altamont

11. sac., t., L., M., om 81.E. Axo
EURVET OR ABBA

922' FWL 2,124' FSL
SEC 24-T2S-R5W

14. PERMIT NO. 16. ELEVATIONE (Show whether Dr, RT, UK, ete,) 12. COUNTY OE PARIBM 18. STATE

43-013-31118 6,273' GR Duchesne Utah

"· CheckAppropnate BoxTo indicate Nature of Notice, Report,or OtherData
NOTICE Or INTENTION TO: BUBEROUENT REPOET 07:

TEST WATER BRUT•Orr PULL OE ALTER CAsfNC WATEE.8HUT•OFF REPAIRINO WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CAalNG

BHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON' BHOUTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)
i I (NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well

(Other) æl completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DEscRIBE PROPOSED OR COMI*LETED UPERATIONs (Cleurly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Including estimated date of starting nny
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give sunsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this work.) •

Please be advised that CSX Oil & Gas Corporation has merged with Total Minatome
Corporation effective April 27, 1988, with CSX's Name being changed accordingly.

18. I hpreby certity that the for oing is t e and correct

SIGNE TITLE Po o Records

(This space for ederal or State once use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY :

*See instructionson Reverse

O O
Forrn OGCC-1 be
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REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)
i I (NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well
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17. DEscRIBE PROPOSED OR COMI*LETED UPERATIONs (Cleurly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Including estimated date of starting nny
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APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY :

*See instructionson Reverse



swa
TyL TOTAL Minatome Corporation

VIA AIRBORNE

June 16, 1989

Mr. Ronald J. Firth
Associate Director of Oil & Gas JUN211989
State of Utah
Division of Oil, Gas, & Mining DNISIONOF
3 Triad Center, Suite 350 OtL.8AS&MENG
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

Re: Potter #2-4B5
Sec. 24-T2S-R5W
Altamont/Bluebell Field
Duchesne County, Utah

Dear Mr. Firth:

Enclosed in triplicate please find Sundry Notice of TOTAL Minatome
Corporation's change in plans to perforate and acidize the above
referenced well.

If you have any questions or require additional information, please
contact me at (713) 739-3378.

Sincerely,

Debbie E. Knight
Regulatory Administrator

DEK:cg
(22.46)

2 Houston Center, Suite 2000 • P.O. Box 4326 • Houston, Texas 77210-4326
Telephone (713) 739-3000 • Telecopier (713) 739-3160 • Telex

swa
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VIA AIRBORNE
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Corporation's change in plans to perforate and acidize the above
referenced well.

If you have any questions or require additional information, please
contact me at (713) 739-3378.

Sincerely,

Debbie E. Knight
Regulatory Administrator

DEK:cg
(22.46)

2 Houston Center, Suite 2000 • P.O. Box 4326 • Houston, Texas 77210-4326
Telephone (713) 739-3000 • Telecopier (713) 739-3160 • Telex



DOGMForm 5
May 5, 1987

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING s. r,saas naalONATION AND BERIAI. NO.

Fee
.

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
6. 17 INDIAN. ALLOTTBE 08 28888 NAME

(Do not use thia form for provosals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use "APPIACATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
OIL GAs
wsLI. ws&L orsza

2. xxxx or orsaatoa 8. rAan om LaAas mana

TOTALMinatome Corporation Potter
a. AÐDRESS OF OPMBATOR 9. WELL NO.

P. 0. Box 4326 Houston, Texas &
\~7 2-24BS

4. LOCATION or w-LI. (Report location blearly and in accordance Wi t 8 10. PIELD AND POOL, 08 WILDCAT
See also space 17 below.)
at ..rra• Altamont/Bl uebe11

922' FWL& 2124' FSL JUN211989 "· "L';·u'··ka"'·^""
Sec. 24-T2S-R5W

H. I NUMBER 18. staTAzzoNs (Show whether Dr. aT, aa 12, COUNTY 08 PARIBM 18, STATE

Permi t #43-013-31118 6273' GR 01LGAS&MINING Duchesne Iltah
ze· CheckAppropnate BoxTo indicate Nature of Nottee, Report,or OtherData

NOTICE OP INTENTION 20 ° SUBBBQUENT REPORT 07:

TERT WATER BRUT•OPP PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-Orr REPAIRING WELL

PRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASINO

SHOOT 08 ACIDIZE ABANDON* BROOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CIIANGE PLANS X (Other)
(Nors: Report resulta of multiple completion on Wel

(Other)
......

('ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

1Î. DESCRIBE PitBPOSED OR CUM1*LETED OPERATroNs (Clenriy state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti•
nent to this work.) *

Proposed Procedure:
1. MIRU service rig and install BOP.
2. Pull 2-3/8" tubing string.
3. Pull 2-7/8" tubing string, pump cavity, and BHAr
4. RIH with Baker milling shoe and packer picker and drill out Baker PA-1

packer @ 10,360'.
5. Clean out 5" line to 13,135'. Circulate hole clean with 2% KCLwater.
6. Perforate zones as per attachment. Note pressure change on casing, if any.
7. If well has pressure and is trying to flow, set Baker Model FA-1 packer on wireline

@ 10,360'. Run lockset packer or equivelent on tubing if well is not flowing.
8. Acidize all Wasatch perforations with ±30,000 gallons 15% HCl acid with 891

ball sealers in stages. Alternate acid/ball sealer stages with rock salt/benzoic
acid flake diverter mixture.

9. Flow or swab back acid water.
10. Put well back on pump or flow test.

1$. I hproby cer that the foregoing is true and correct

.
Regulatory Administrator vara 6/16/89

( space for Federal or State omce use)

°2oN8nOF
APPROVE, IF BR:

OF UTAH DIVISION OF
OIL GAS AND INING

*SeeInstructionsa a
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( space for Federal or State omce use)

°2oN8nOF
APPROVE, IF BR:

OF UTAH DIVISION OF
OIL GAS AND INING

*SeeInstructionsa a



POTTER#2-2485
SEC 24-T2S-RSW

DUCHESNECOUNTY,UTAH

RECOMMENDEDWASATCHINFILL PERFORATIONS

10,502-10,504' 2' 10,825-10,827' 2' - - 12,405-12,408' 3'
10,513-10,515' 2' 10,833-10,835' 2' 12,418-12,420' 2'
10,528-10,530' 2' 10,846-10,848' 2' 12,436-12,439' 3'
10,545-10,547' 2' 10,862-10,866' 4' ' 12,444-12,446' 2'
10,551-10,553' 2' 10,890-10,894' 4' 12,458-12,460' 2'
10,569-10,570' l' 10,915-10,916' l' 12,485-12,487' 2'
10,576-10,578' 2' 11,077-11,078' l' 12,536-12,538' 2'
10,586-10,588' 2' 11,092-11,093' l' 12,590-12,596' 6'
10,597-10,599' 2' 11,099-11,100' l' 12,610-12,612' 2'
10,622-10,624' 2' 11,131-11,133' 2' 12,690-12,692' 2'
10,647-10,649' 2' 11,136-11,138' 2' 12,703-12,705' 2'
10,655-10,656' l' 11,250-11,252' 2' 12,722-12,724' 2'
10,668-10,669' l' 11,434-11,436' 2' 12,815-12,817' 2'
10,675-10,677' 2' 11,472-11,473' l' 12,820-12,822' 2'
10,686-10,688' 2' 11,476-11,479' 3' 12,831-12,833' 2'
10,694-10,696' 2' 11,513-11,515' 2' 12,870-12,872' 2'
10,712-10,715' 3' 11,781-11,782' l' 12,914-12,916' 2'
10,728-10,730' 2' 11,988-11,992' 4' 12,928-12,930' 2'
10,737-10,738' l' 12,198-12,200' 2' 12,984-12,986' 2'
10,748-10,751' 3' 12,283-12,286' 3' 13,023-13,025' 2'
10,766-10,768' 2' 12,308-12,311' 3' 13,050-13,052' 2'
10,775-10,777' 2' 12,352-12,356' 4' 13,096-13,098' 2'
10,796-10,798' 2' 12,364-12,365' l' 13,111-13,113' 2'
10,801-10,803' 2'

Infill Perforations:

10,502' - 13,113'
70 Zones
148' Net
444 Holes

Total Perforations:

10,502' - 13,113'
147 Zones
297' Net
891 Holes

SC:cg
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DOGM'Form 5
May 5, 1987

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING . LEABB DESIONATION AND SERIAl, NO.

Fee

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTES OB TRIBE NAME

(Do not use this form for proDosals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use "APPI.lCATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

• Î. UNIT ASSEEMENT NAMS
OIL GAS
WELL WELI, OTHER

2. NAME OP 0758A208 8. PARM 08 LEASE NAMS

TOTALMinatome Corporation Potter
8. ADDERES OF OFERA20B O. WELL NO.

P. 0. Box 4326 Houston, Texas 77210-4326 2-24B5
4. A ONs

ce b
e rt location blearly and in accordance wit 10. riaLD AND room, on wn.acar

Altamont/Bluebell
922' GEL & 2124' FSL 11... 2 .... ass.a..

AUG 16 1989 Sec. 24-T2S-R5W

14•AP I NUMBER 1L stavarroNs (Show whether or, ar, on, ete.) 12. COUNTY os ranssa 18. stars

Permit #43-013-31118 6273' GR Duchesne Utah
te· CheckAppropnote BoxTo IndicateNature of Notice, Report,or OtherDate

NOTICS OF INTENTION TG: BUmsaQUENT REPORT 07:

TEST WATER 82ECT-OFF PULL 08 ALTER CASING W&TER SHOT.OST REPhlRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MCLTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TERATMENT ALTERING CASINO

BHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* BROUTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDOMMENT*

REFAIR WELL CtfANGE PLANs (Other)
(Nots. Report resnits of multiple completion on Wel

(Other) ('ompletion or Recolapletton Report and Log form.)
17. DESCRIDE PROPOSED 014 COMPLETED OPERATIONs (Clenrly state all pertínent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti•
.

nent to this work.) •

Acidized well 7-11-89 thru 7-20-89 as per the following procedure:

1. MIRU service rig and install BOP.
2. Pull 2-3/8" tubing string.
3. Pull 2-7/8" tubing string, pump cavity, and BHA.
4. RIH with Baker milling shoe and packer picker and drill out Baker PA-1

packer @ 10,360'.
5. Clean out 5" liner to 13,135'. Circulate hole clean with 2% KCLwater.
6. Perforate zones as per attachment. Note pressure change on casing, if any.
7. If well has pressure and is trying to flow, set Baker Model FA-1 packer on wireline

@10,360'. Run lockset packer or equivalent on tubing if well is not flowing.
8. Acidize all asatch perforations with 130,000 gallons 15% HC1 acid with 891 ball

sealers in stages. Alternate acid/ball sealer stages with rock salt/benzoic
acid flake diverter mixture.

9. Flow or swab back acid water.
10. Put well back on pump or flow test.

18. I hproby certit that the foregoi g is true and correct
Regulatory Administrator 8/8/89

PTONER - TITLE DATE

(This space for Federal or State omce use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, 17 ANY:

*See Instructionson ReverseSide
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POTTER#2-2485
SEC 24-T2S-R5W

DUCHESNECOUNTY,UTAH
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Infill Perforations:

10,502' - 13,113'
70 Zones
148' Net
444 Holes

Total Perforations:

147 Zones
297' Net
891 Holes

SC:cg
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POTTER#2-24B5
SEC. 24-T2S-R5W

ALTAMONT/BLUEBELLFIELD
DUCHESNECOUNTY,UTAH

WELL STUUS : WO CURRENTACTIVITY : Trip in to CD lnr.
(07-11-89) MI & RU General Well Serv. NOWH& NU BOPs. Trip out 2-3/8" tbg.RU rental equip.
(07-12-89) Fin trip out w/2-3/8" & 2-7/8" tbg w/BHA. PU 5" pkr plucker & trin
in w/tbg to TOL.
(07-13-89) Mill out 5" FA-1 r. Trip out tbg. Trip in w/4-1/8" mill, 97 jts
2-3/8"_ tbg & 336 jts_2-7/8" to clean out lnr.
07/14/89 2D :

WELLSTMUS : WO CURRENTACTIVITY : Trip out tbg.
00 lnr to 13,163'. Trip out tbg.

07/15/89 TD :

WE:LLSTMUS : WO CURRENTACTIVITY : Tst pkr.

Perf all infill Wasatch perf - 70 zones (748') 444 holes. Trip in 4 jts 2-3/8"
tbg & 2-7/8" tbg to set pkr @10,320'. Tst pkr.
07/16/89 ID :

WE:LL STUUS : WO CURRENT ACTIVITY : Swab back load.
RU & acdz all perfs in Wasatch w/32,000 gals 15% HCl w/add. Diverter stages @13 BPM, 7100 psi. ISIP 3280 psi, 15 min 1260 psi. Swab back load.

07/17/89 TD :

WELLSTMUS : WO CURRENTACTIVITY : SD for Sunday.
07/18/89 2D :

WELL STEUS : WO CURRENT ACTIVITY : SIFN.

7:00 AM tbg press 1500 psi. Bled dwn press. Made 8 swab runs to 9600'. Made
43 BW, & 27 BO. Rel pkr & trip out. LD BHA. Trip in kill string. SIEN.

07/19/89 TD :

Wi:LL STEUS : WO CURRENT ACTIVITY : Circ to clean out tbg.
Trip out kill string. PU BHA & trip in -7/8" tbg. Trip in 2-3/8",

.space out
tbg. ND BOP & NU WH. Circ to clean out .

07/20/89 ID :

WELL STATUS : WO CURRENTACTIVITY : On prod.
Pmo in pop. RD & MO. Made 60 BO, 54 MCF, 64 BW, & 20 bb1s residue 40 SPM/2000 psi. FINAL
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O OMMM
jg L TOTAL Minatome Corporation

August 4, 1989

Mr. Ronald J. Firth
AsasociateUtDihrector of Oil & Gas AUG16 1989
Division of Oil, Gas, & Mining
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203 UK máMi Nb

Re: Potter #2-24B5
Sec. 24-T2S-R5W
Altamont/Bluebell Field
Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

TOTALMinatome Corporation herein submits in triplicate DOGMForm 5,
Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells for the above referenced well for
your review and approval.

Should you have any questions or require additional information,
please contact me at (713) 739-3378.

Sincerely,

OILANDGAS

DTS SLS
Debbie E. Knight
Regulatory Administrator

DEK:cg
(24.12)

FILE

2 Houston Center, Suite 2000 • P.O. Box 4326 • Houston, Texas 77210-4326
Telephone (713) 739-3000 • Telecopier (713) 739-3160 • Tele×
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TOTAL Minatome Corporation

September 5, 1989
TO ALL WORKING INTEREST OWNERS(See Attached Addressee List)
RE: Altamont BluebellPotter #2-2435 - - 3 -Ö! "i - '

Duchesne County, Utah 23
Gentlemen:

TOTAL Minatome Corporation is resigning, effective October

1, 1989, as Operator of the above captioned well. In accordance

with the operating agreement covering the above captioned, TOTAL
Minatome Corporation nominates and votes for ANR Production
Company as successor operator. TOTAL Minatome Corporation's vote
and ANR Production Company's approval of same, totals the
necessary majority vote to elect ANR Production Company as
Operator.

dn Manager-Onshore
JRAldc
Enclosure

LETTERS/090589G.DEB

2 Houston Center, Suite 2000 • P.O. Box 4326 • Houston, Texas
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ANR Production Company
.

The Energy PeopleA SUBSIDIARY OF THECOASTALCORPORAflON

OCT 06 1989 OILANDGASOctober 3, 1989
DN ONOF DRN RJF

NW JRB GLH

DTS SLS

State of Utah . \g
Department of Natural Resources
Division of Oil & Gas 'y*AAS

3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

// FLES
Attention: John Baza ¿ V

Re: ANR Production Company takes over operatorship of wells in Duchesne (;,- 4 )County.

Dear Mr. Baza:

As of October 1, 1989 ANR Production Company took over operatorship of
eleven wells in the Altamont field, located in Duchesne County, from TOTAL
Minatome Corporation. Please see attached list of wells.

We would ask that the wells be added to our Blanket Bond. Also attached
are copies of signed letters from TOTAL Minatome Corporation authorizing
this takeover.

If you need further information, please contact me.

Sincerely

Brenda W. Swank
Regulatory Analyst

BWS:dh

Attachments

Lynn Carter-Risk Management
Les Streeb/Well File
Jon Nelsen

600 17THSTREET
SUITE BOOS
P.O.BOX0749
DENVER, COLORADO 80201-0749
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Stateof Utah e
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

Norman H. Bangerter
DIVISION OF OIL, GASAND MINING

Governor

Dee C. Hansen
355 West North Temple

Executive Director 3 Triad Center, Suite 350

Dianne R. Nielson, Ph.D. Salt Lake City,Utah 84180-1203

Division Director 801-538-5340

November 17, 1989

Mr. Gene W. Anderson
Total Minatome Corporation
P.O. Box 4326
Houston, Texas 77210-4326

Dear Mr. Anderson:

Re: Notificationof Lease Sale or Transfer

The division recently received notification of a change of operator from Total Minatome
Corporation to ANR Production Company for the following wells located on fee leases:

Lamicq 2-5B2 AP1 No. 43-013-30784
Broadhead Unit 2-32BS API No. 43-013-31036
Hanskutt 2-23B5 API No. 43-013-30917
Duncan 2-9B5 APl No. 43-013-30719 =

PotteF2446 API No. 43-013-31118
Burton 2-15B5 API No. 43-013-31044
Tew 2-10BS API No. 43-013-31125
Ute 2-34A4 API No. 43-013-30978

Evans 2-19B3 API No. 43-013-31113
Rust 3-4B3 API No. 43-013-31070

Rule R615-2-10, of the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules, states:

"The owner of a lease shall provide notification to any person with an
interest in such lease, when all or part of that interest in the lease is sold
or transferred."

an equal opportunity
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Page 2
Mr. Gene Anderson
November 17, 1989

This letter is written to advise Total Minatome Corporation of its responsibility to notify
all individuals with an interest in these leases of the change of operator. Please provide
written documentation of this notification to the division no later than
December 15, 1989.

ely

Don Staley
Administrative Supervisor

Idc
cc: D.R. Nielson

R.J. Firth
Well files
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TOTAL Minatome Corporation

December 4, 1989

State of Utah
355 West North Temple tÛ
3 Triad Center, Suite 350 so -2Z8C

Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203 p,cy, -3//22

Attention: Don Staley

RE: Altamont/Bluebell Prospect
Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to your letter dated November 17, 1989, enclosed
you will find copies of letters written to the various working
interest owners notifying each party that TOTAL Minatome
Corporation resigned as Operator of the wells listed in your
letter, effective October 1, 1989. These letters to the working
interest owners represent written notification.

Sincerely,

Debbie Copeland
Land Department

dc
Enclosure

2 Houston Center, Suite 2000 • P.O. Box 4326 • Houston, Texas 77210-4326
Telephone (713) 739-3000 • Telecopier (713) 739-3160 • Telex
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EPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
IVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

Norman H. Bangerte
Governo

. , 5 West North Temple
Dee C. Hans

Executive Direct ,'nad Center, Suite 350

Dianne R. Nielson, Ph.D. Salt Lake City,Utah 84180-1203

DivisionDin-etor 801-538-5340

November 17, 1989

Mr. Gene W. Anderson
Total Minatome Corporation
P.O. Box 4326
Houston, Texas 77210-4326

Dear Mr. Anderson:
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Hanskutt 2-23BS API No. 43-013-30917
Duncan 2-9B5 API No. 43-013-30719
Potter 2-24BS API No. 43-013-31118
Burton 2-15B5 APl No. 43-013-31044
Tew 2-1085 API No. 43-013-31125

- Ute 2-34A4 API No. 43-013-30978
- Evans 2-19B3 API No. 43-013-31113

-- Rust 3-4B3 API No. 43-013-31070

Rule R615-2-10, of the Utah Oiland Gas Conservation General Rules, states:

« "The owner of a lease shall provide notification to any person with an
interest in such lease, when all or part of that interest in the lease is sold
or transferred."

an equal opportunity
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r FORM9
STATEOF UTAH

DIVISIONOF OIL, GASANDMINING
3. LEASE DE310NATIO.9 & SEAIAA. NO•

ree ·

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
.. arisma.s.xx.a.omsoaxas.ssa.==

(Do not use this form for proposaas to driH or to deenen or plus back to a different reservaar.
Use "APPtJCATION FOR PERilIT-" for auch propokals.) - Ñ/A

1. , 7. UNIT AUKT.EMENT NAME
OIL GAS
WELL WEI.z. own

' N/A
2. NAME OF OPERaiTOR * * 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

ANR Production Company Potter

2. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. WE1.1..NO.

P.O. Box 749, Denver, Colorado 80201-0749 2-24B5
4. i.OCATIO:: GF WE .i.. .sport tocauencleasar aan an accornance wnn any atate requirements. '0. FIELD A.ND POOL.OK Wil.OCAT

See aise soaca 17 below.)

x ..,sa=•922' FWL & 2124' FSL Altamont

As proposed prod. som
11. SEC. T. A. AL. OA Bl.K.ANA

Same as above suavsY on anna

Section 24, T2S-R5W

14. API NO, 1& LEVATIONS (Show waeaner DF, RT. GR.stc.h 12. COUNÎY IZ• ETA
43-013-31118 (0 6273' GR Duchesne Utah

a- Check Appropriate Box To indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Ottier Data
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUESEOVENT REPORT OF:

TE3T WATER SHUT•OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFy REPAIRING WEt.L

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPt.E CO.itFL£7E TRACTURE TREATitENT ALTERING CA38NG

51100T OR ACIOlze X AaamooN snootswo on Acamzzuo As^N¤¤xataxT

REPAIR WEt.L C3tA.NGE PLANs if3theek
(Note: Report resuãLs os muAttple complesson on WE

(Other)
- Consstation or Resenspistson Report and I.06 gotim.)

Arraox. ext: woax wtr.t. sTART
12-31-90

DATE OF COMPLETION

\ 7. DE5CRISE PROPOSED OR CQtetPt.ETED OPERATIONS (Clearty state all eersmem desaals, and give pertment dates.incindtag estimasei date of

startmg any proposed work. If weit is directionally drailed. mye momrface locations and mesured and tme vertscai depths for au mastiessand zones

Pcrtinent tu Lins work.)

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

Please see the attached procedure to clean out the 5" liner, perforate,

and acidize the Wasatch formation on the above-referenced well.

APPROVED BY THE STATE
OF UTAH DIVISION F
OIL, AS, AND M '

DATE•
BY:

'8. I hereoy has goreso Lage ana co

O

APPROVED BY TITI.E DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAI..IF ANY:

See instructions On Reverse Side
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WORKOVERPROCEDURE

Potter #2-24B5
Section 24, T2S, R5W

Duchesne County, Utah

WELLDATA

Location: 922' FWL& 2124' FSL
Elevation: 6273' GL; 6293' KB
Total Depth: 13,200' PBTD: 13,164'
Casing: 9-5/8", 36# J-55 ST&C @4500', cmt'd w/1900 sx

7", 26#, P-110 LT&C from 8983' to 10,500'
7", 26#, N-80 LT&Cfrom 0 to 8983', cmt'd w/870 sxs
5", 18#, P-110 FL4S from 10,306' to 13,192', cmt'd w/375 sxs

Tubing: 2-7/8" N-80 DSS-HT
2-3/8" N-80 DSS-HT

TUBULARDATA

Description ID Drift Capacity Burst Collapse
B/F psi psi

9-5/8" 36# 0-55 ST&C 8.921" 8.765" .0773
3520 2020

7" 26# N-80 LT&C 6.276" 6.151" .0382 7240 5410

7" 26# P-110 LT&C 6.276" 6.151" .0382 9960 6210
5" 18# P-110 LT&C 4.276" 4.151" .0177 13940 13450
3-1/2" 9.3# N-80 EUE 2.992" 2.867" .00870 10160 10530
2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 IJ·NuLok 2.441" 2.347" .00579

10570 11160

WELLHISTORY

November 1985: Initial completion. Perf from 10,808' to 13,134', 447 total holes.
Flowed naturally 196 BOPD,493 MCFPDand 163 BWPD.

January 1986: Acidized from 10,808' to 13,134' w/18,000 gals 15%HC1 and 13,500 gals

2% KCl. Flowed 597 B0PD, 806 MCFPD,285 BWPDon a 15/64" chk w/FTP of
1075 psi.

June 1986: Install hydraulic lift. Production improved from 33 BOPOto 81 80PD.

July 1989: Perf from 10,502' to 13,113', 444 holes, 3 SPF. Acidize from 10,502' to
13,134' w/32,000 gals 15% HC1. Prod improved from 10 BOPOto 60 80PD.

PRESENTSTATUS: SI w/tbg leak since April 1990. Last production 11 B0PD, 19 MCFPD,98 BWPD.

PROCEDURE

1. MIRU service rig. NDwellhead and NUB0PE. POOHw/sidestring. Release TAC and POOH

w/production equipment.

2. PU & RIH w/4-1/8" mill and CO tools. CO 5" LN to PBTD@
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9 e
rkover Procedure

Potter #2-24B5
Page Two

3. RU wireline service company. Perf the Wasatch from 10,328' to 12,950', 3 SPF, 72

settings, 120° phasing, 216 total holes per the attached prog.

4. PU & RIH w/5" Mountain States Arrowset 1 10K pkr, on/off tool and F nipple, ±62' 2-

7/8" 6.5# Il NuLok tbg, ±10,260' 3-1/2" N-80 9.3# tbg. Set pkr @±10,320'.

5. Acidize perfs from 10,328' to 13,134', 1107 total holes (216 new, 891 old) w/33,210
gals 15% HCl w/1296 1.1 sg BS and specified additives. Max treating pressure 8500

psi. Note: The above acid job should be designed to include:

A) All fluid to be heated to 150°F.

B) Precede acid w/250 bb1s 3% KCl wtr w/10 gals per 1000 gals scale inhibitor and 500
gals Xylene.

C) All water to contain 3% KC1.
D) Acidize w/6 stages of 5535 gals each containing 216 1.1 sg BS evenly spaced and

5 diverter stages of 1500 gals gelled saltwater w/ 1/2# gal Benzoic acid flakes
and rock salt.

6. Flow/swab back acid load.

7. If well flows, drop plug. Release from on/off tool. POOHand LD 3-1/2" tbg. RIH
w/2-7/8" prod string. Sting into pkr. Retrieve plug and return well on line. RIH
w/artificial lift when well dies. Hydro test, TIH.

8. If well does not flow, release pkr, POOHand LD 3-1/2" tbg. PU & RIH w/artificial
lift equipment. Hydro test, TIH.
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Proposed Perforation Schedule
Potter #2-2485

RW/SW Section 24, T2S-R5W
Duchesne County, Utah

Reference Log: Dresser Atlas DIFL, Run 1 dated 9-29-85 and Run 2 dated 10-29-85.

Wasatch Formation

10,328 10,410 11,017 11,502 11,900 12,346 12,736

333 416 024 514 903 377 783

349 421 540 963 382 790

354 434 11,143 544 971

359 437 175 12,430 12,846

364 450 179 11,611 12,071 468 853

373 486 657 481 898

378 490 11,311 12,112

391 493 334 11,765 129 12,501 12,950

394 342 794 562

10,947 12,210
960 11,429 11,827 228 12,630

988 453 855 291 673

482 880 684

Totals: 65 zones, 72 feet and 216 holes @ 3JSPF

Wendell Cole
October 15,
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FORM9
STATEOF UTAH

DIVISIONOF OIL, GASANDMININf.
S. LEASE DT.StGNAft0N & SERIAL NO.

Fee
L 6. IF INDIAN. ALA.OTTEE OR TRISE N^¾©

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WEL
(Do not use this form for proposaas to drill or to dessen or ping back to a different reservozz.

Use ••APPLICATION FOR PERit1T-" for suma proposals.) N/A
1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

Oll. GAS
WELL WEI.I. OTHER NO

2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FARM OR LEASENAME

ANR Production Company Potter
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. WELL.NO.

P. O. Box 749, Denver, Colorado 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 | 2-24B5
4. i.OCATI 2; GF WE'.I. ¿?.amart locanoncleasar ane us accornance wun any árate requarements. '.0. TIEI.D A.ND POOL.OR WILOCAT

See sãse soace &7 below.þ
As sun... Al tamont

922' FWL & 2124' FSL u.ste..x.a..w.oass.x.xxð
At proposed ored. sen• SURVEY OR AAEA

Same as above Sec. 24-T2S-R5W

14. API NO. 13. ELEVATIONS (Show woesner GF, RT. GR.ass.a 12. COUNTY 13. STATE

43-013-31118 6273' GR Duchesne Utah

16- Check Aapropriata Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data
NOTICE Of INTENTION TO: SUBSEOVENT REPORT OF•

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF Ful.L OA ALTER CASING WATER SHUT•OFy REPAIRING Wtt.L

PRACTURE TREAT LIMI.TIPLE CO'etFLETE TRACTURE TREATatENT ALTERING CA38NO

31100T om AcinizE ABANDON SHOOTING OR ACIDittNo AsANDONatENT

REPAIR WELL CilANGE FL.kNS Inthawk

(Other)
(Note: Aapon results os muittste complesson on Wen

- Comotetten or Recomplesson Aepen and I.og gesma

Arraox. DATE woax WII.I. START DATE OF COMPI.ETION 9/8| l

17. DE5CRist PROPOSED OR COMPLETED orEllATIONS (Clearty stateaneerstnantdesaus.andgivepartsnansdates.incingliasensimateddateet
startant any proposed work. W wen is diraattannuy draued. sive subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for aRiitasiliiBSE 80Bem

partsnant to this work.)
1/25/91-2/8/91: * Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

1) MIRU. Release 2-3/8" sidestring from cavity. Press test to 2500 psi. POOH w/2-3/8"
tbg. and stinger. POOH w/2-7/8" tbg. and hyd. pump BHA.

2) CO 5" liner. Left BHA and 40 jts. 2-3/8" tbg. in hole. Screwed into fish. PU
3000# wt. POOH w/fish.

3) Perfed Wasatch (10,322-12,950') w/3-1/8" esg. guns, 3 SPF, 1200 phasing. No
pressure increase. FL @ 5400'.

4) RIH w/5" pkr. on 3-1/2" tbg. and set @ 10,321'. Press test esg. to 2000#.
Acidized perfs w/33,210 gals. 15% HCL + additives and 1296-1.1 BS. MTP 8600#,
ATP 7600#, MIR 30 BPM, AIR 27 BPM, ISIP 3200#, 15 min 2240#. Swabbed/flowed
back well.

5) Rel. E< POOH w/pkr. RIH w/hyd. pump BHA. Hydrotest to 8500#. Set TAC @ 10,527'.
RIH w/2-3/8" sidestring. RIH w/ stinger on 2-3/8" tbg. ND BOP's. PT to 4000#.
NU WH. RDSU.

6) Place well on hyd. pump production.

(This suaes for federat er State estica uses

APPROVED SY TITI.E DATE
CONDITIONS OF AffROVAI..IF ANY:

See instructions On Reverse Side
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4 FORM 9
*

TATE OF UTAH
DIVlSIO OlL, GAS AND MINING w

5. Lease Designation and Serial Number:

See Attached
6. If indian, Allotteeor Tribe Name:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS See Attached
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 7. Unit Agreement Name:

Use APPL1CATlONFOR PERM1TTO DRILLOR DEEPEN form for such proposals. See Attached
1. Type of Wel1: 8. Well Name and Number:

OIL GAS OTHER: See Attached
2. Name of Operator: 9. APl Well Number:

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation See Attached
3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455 See Attached
4. Location of Well

Footages: See Attached County: See Attached
QQ, Sec., T., R., M.: See Attached state: Utah

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEÓUENT REPORT

(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

Abandon New Construction Abandon * New Construction
Repair Casing [¯¯]

Pull or Alter Casing [
¯]

Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing[¯¯
Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans Perforate
Convertto Injection Perforate Convertto injection Vent or Flare
Fracture Treat or Acidize Vent or Flare Fracture Treat or Acidize Water Shut-Off

Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off [X ] Other Change of Operator
Other

Date of work completion

Approximate date work will start Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPŒTION REPORT AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true
vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to thiswork.)

Please be advised that effective December 27, 1995,ANR Production Company relinquished and Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation
assumed operations for the subject wells (see attached). Bond coverage pursuant to 43 CFR 3104 for lease activities is being
provided by Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation under the following bonds: State of Utah #102103, BLM Nationwide Bond
#U605382-9, and BIA Nationwide Bond #11-40-66A. Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation, as operator, agrees to be responsible
under the terms and conditions of the leases for the operations conducted upon leased lands.

Bønnie Carson, Sr. Environmental & Safety Analyst
ANR Production Company OF OL GAS & MININ

Sheila Bremer
Environmental & Safety Analyst

Name & Signature: Title: Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation Date: 03/07/96

(This space for State use only)

(5/94) (See instructions on Reverse
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(5/94) (See instructions on Reverse



CHANGE OF OPERATOR - From ANR Production Co. To Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 03/07/96 -- Page 3 of 4

If Indian, LOCATION CF WELL
Lease Designation Allottee or Šection, TownshipWe/I Name & No. API No. & Serial Number Tribe Name CA No. Footages &Range Field County

Miles 2-1B5 43-013-31257 Fee Ofg N/A N/A 156T FSL & 1868' FWL NESW, 1-2S-5W Altamont DuchesneMiles 2-3B3 43-013-31261 Fee | /() N/A N/A 2078' FSL &247T FWL NESW, 3-2S-3W Altamont DuchesneMonsen 1-21A3 43-013-30082 Patented Fp N/A N/A 1546' FNL& 705' FEL SENE, 21-1S-3W Altamont DuchesneMonsen 2-22A3 43-013-31265 Fee O†g N/A N/A 1141' FSL &251' FWL SWSW, 22-1S-3W Altamont DuchesneI\/lurdock 2-2685 43-013-31124 Fee SS/ N/A N/A 852' FWL & 937' FSL SWSW, 26-2S-5W Altamont DuchesnePotter 1-24B5 43-013-30356 Patented 3p N/A N/A 1110' FNL& 828' FEL SENE, 24-2S-5W Altamont DuchesnePotter 1-2B5 43-013-30293 Patented | J/// N/A N/A 1832' FNL & 1385' FEL SWNE, 2-2S-5W Altamont DuchesnePotter 2-24B5 43-013-31118 Fee j'jf N/A N/A 922' FWL & 2124' FSL NWSW, 24-2S-5W Altamont DuchesnePotter 2-6B4 43-013-31249 Fee j p¶¶ N/A NIA 151T FSL & 1732' FWL NESW, 6-2S-4W Altamont DuchesnePowell 1-33A3 43-013-30105 Fee N/A N/A 2340' FNL& 660' FEL SENE, 33-1S-3W Altamont DuchesnePowell 2-33A3 43-013-30704 Fee Qþ N/A N/A 1582' FSL & 1558' FWL NESW, 33-1S-3W Altamont DuchesneReeder 1-17B5 43-013-30218 Patented | |O N/A N/A 1619' FNL& 563' FEL SENE, 17-2S-5W Altamont DuchesneRemington 1-34A3 43-013-30139 Patented | g N/A N/A 919' FNL & 1596' FEL NWNE, 34-1S-3W Altamont DuchesneRemington 2-34A3 43-013-31091 Fee jggy N/A N/A 1645' FWL& 1833' FSL NESW, 34-1S-3W Altamont DuchesenRoper 1-14B3 43-013-30217 Fee j¶ N/A N/A 1623' FNL &2102' FWL SENW, 14-2S-3W Bluebell DuchesneRust 1-4B3 43-013-30063 Patented 'l §g N/A N/A 2030' FNL &660' FEL SENE, 4-2S-3W Altamont DuchesneRust 3-4B3 43-013-31070 Fee 57(y N/A . N/A 1072' FSL & 1460' FWL SESW, 4-2S-3W Altamont DuchesneSmith 1-31B5 43-013-30577 Fee 65 N/A N/A 2232' FSL & 1588' FEL NWSE, 31-2S-5W Altamont DuchesneState 1-19B1 43-013-30688 ¡Q/,- Eg-Feer N/A N/A 1043' FWL& 1298' FNL NWNW,19-2S-1W Bluebell DuchesneStevenson 3-29A3 43-013-31376 Fee || g N/A N/A 134T FNL & 1134' FWL CNW, 29-1S-3W Altamont DuchesneTew 1-15A3 43-013-30529 Fee N/A N/A 1215' FEL & 1053' FNL NENE, 15-1S-3W Altamont DuchesneTew 1-1B5 43-013-30264 Patented N/A N/A 1558' FNL & 671' FEL NENE, 1-2S-5W Altamont DuchesneTodd 2-21A3 43-013-31296 Fee N/A N/A 2456' FSL & 1106' FWL NWSW, 21-1S-3W Bluebell DuchesneWeikert 2-29B4 43-013-31298 Fee (j '& N/A N/A 1528' FNL& 1051' FWL SWNW, 29-2S-4W Bluebell DuchesneWhitehead 1-22A3 43-013-30357 Patented / fffg N/A N/A 2309' FNL &2450' FEL SWNE, 22-1S-3W Altamont DuchesneWinkler 1-28A3 43-013-30191 Patented |¶60 N/A N/A 660' FNL & 1664' FEL NWNE, 28-1S-3W Altamont DuchesneWinkler 2-28A3 43-013-31109 Fee fr/Ej N/A N/A 1645' FWL &919' FSL SESW, 28-1S-3W Altamont DuchesneWright 2-13B5 43-013-31267 Fee || N/A N/A 2442' FNL&2100' FWL SENW, 13-2S-5W Altamont DuchesneYoung 1-29B4 43-013-30246 Patented | N/A . N/A 2311' FNL & 876' FEL SENE, 29-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneYoung 2-15A3 43-013-31301 Fee fj Ñ/A
_

N/A 1827' FWL & 1968' FWL NWSW, 15-1S-3W Altamont DuchesneYoung 2-30B4 43-013-31366 Fee || N/A N/A 2400' FNL & 1600' FWL SENW, 30-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneUte Tribal 2-21B6 43-013-31424 14-20-H62-2489 | § Ute 9639 1226' FSL & 1306' FEL SESE, 22-2S-6W Altamont Duchesne ITTUte 1-34A4 43-013-30076 14-20-H62-1774 | $ Ute 9640 1050' FWL & 1900' FNL SWNW, 12-2S-3W Bluebell Duchesne 7 ¶¶Ute 1-36A4 43-013-30069 14-20-H62-1793 | þ Ute 9642 1544' FEL & 1419' FNL SWNE, 28-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne 9/ogiUte 1-1B4 43-013-30129 14-20-H62-1798 | 00 Ute 9649 500' FNL &2380' FWL NENW, 1-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneUte Jenks 2-1B4 43-013-31197 14-20-H62-1782 jg L| Ute 9649 116T FSL & 920' FWL SWSW, 33-1N-2W Bluebell Duchesne 1CI loEvans 2-19B3 43-013-31113 14-20-H62-1734 | 7-ry Ute 9678 983' FSL &683' FEL SESE, 21-2S-6W Altamont Duchesne 16¾Ute 3-12B3 43-013-31379 14-20-H62-1810 ||Lj p Ute 9679 2219' FNL &2213' FEL SWNE, 8-1S-1E Bluebell Uintah ¶c seUte 1-28B4 43-013-30242 14-20-H62-1745 jg Ute 9681 172T FWL & 1675' FSL NESW, 19-2S-3W Altamont Duchesne 1/479Murdock 2-34BS 43-013-31132 14-20-H62-2511 Ute 9685 .1420' FNL& 1356' FEL SWNE, 34-1S-4W Altamont Duchesne ¶d òUte Tribal 10-13A4 43-013-30301 14-20-H62-1685 § ;UT Ute 9C-126 2230' FNL& 1582' FEL SWNE, 33-1N-2W Bluebell Duchesne 10--/40Ute 1-8A1E 43-04T-30173 14-20-H62-2714 gg Ute 96138 1543' FSL &2251' FWL NESW, 34-2S-5W Altamont Duchesne ¶p2EUte 2-33Z2 43-013-31111 14-20-H62-1703 95| Üte 9C140 802' FNL& 1545' FWL NWNE, 13-1S-4W Altamont Duchesne 90R(aUte Tribal 1-33Z2 43-013-30334 14-20-H62-1703 ýQ Ute 9C140 1660' FSL & 917' FWL NWSW, 18-2S-3W Altamont Duchesne utt(7NIMýin RancKi-18B3 43-013-31297 14-20-H62-1744,4521,4522,4554 N/A fj J UTU70814 975' FNL&936' FEL NENE, 36-iS-4W Altamont Duchesne 1(oS2,
Ute Tribal 2-22B6 43-013-31444 14-20-H62-4644 ///a¶ Ute UTU73743 1401' FSL & 1295' FWL NWSW, 15-2S-6W Altamont Duchesne IN/7ÑUte 1-15B6 43-013-31484 14-20-H62-4647 ||g/ Ute UTU73964 1879' FNL & 1070'.FEL SENE, 1-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne %ŸŸUte 1-25A3 43-013-30370 14-20-H62-1802 |¶ge , Ute N/A 172T FNL & 1784' FEL SWNE, 25-1S-3W Bluebell DuchesneUte 1-26A3 43-013-30348 14-20-H62-1803 g'fo Ute N/A 1869' FNL& 1731' FWL SENW, 26-1S-3W Bluebell
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_

N/A 1827' FWL & 1968' FWL NWSW, 15-1S-3W Altamont DuchesneYoung 2-30B4 43-013-31366 Fee || N/A N/A 2400' FNL & 1600' FWL SENW, 30-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneUte Tribal 2-21B6 43-013-31424 14-20-H62-2489 | § Ute 9639 1226' FSL & 1306' FEL SESE, 22-2S-6W Altamont Duchesne ITTUte 1-34A4 43-013-30076 14-20-H62-1774 | $ Ute 9640 1050' FWL & 1900' FNL SWNW, 12-2S-3W Bluebell Duchesne 7 ¶¶Ute 1-36A4 43-013-30069 14-20-H62-1793 | þ Ute 9642 1544' FEL & 1419' FNL SWNE, 28-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne 9/ogiUte 1-1B4 43-013-30129 14-20-H62-1798 | 00 Ute 9649 500' FNL &2380' FWL NENW, 1-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneUte Jenks 2-1B4 43-013-31197 14-20-H62-1782 jg L| Ute 9649 116T FSL & 920' FWL SWSW, 33-1N-2W Bluebell Duchesne 1CI loEvans 2-19B3 43-013-31113 14-20-H62-1734 | 7-ry Ute 9678 983' FSL &683' FEL SESE, 21-2S-6W Altamont Duchesne 16¾Ute 3-12B3 43-013-31379 14-20-H62-1810 ||Lj p Ute 9679 2219' FNL &2213' FEL SWNE, 8-1S-1E Bluebell Uintah ¶c seUte 1-28B4 43-013-30242 14-20-H62-1745 jg Ute 9681 172T FWL & 1675' FSL NESW, 19-2S-3W Altamont Duchesne 1/479Murdock 2-34BS 43-013-31132 14-20-H62-2511 Ute 9685 .1420' FNL& 1356' FEL SWNE, 34-1S-4W Altamont Duchesne ¶d òUte Tribal 10-13A4 43-013-30301 14-20-H62-1685 § ;UT Ute 9C-126 2230' FNL& 1582' FEL SWNE, 33-1N-2W Bluebell Duchesne 10--/40
Ute 1-8A1E 43-04T-30173 14-20-H62-2714 gg Ute 96138 1543' FSL &2251' FWL NESW, 34-2S-5W Altamont Duchesne ¶p2EUte 2-33Z2 43-013-31111 14-20-H62-1703 95| Üte 9C140 802' FNL& 1545' FWL NWNE, 13-1S-4W Altamont Duchesne 90R(aUte Tribal 1-33Z2 43-013-30334 14-20-H62-1703 ýQ Ute 9C140 1660' FSL & 917' FWL NWSW, 18-2S-3W Altamont Duchesne utt(7NIMýin RancKi-18B3 43-013-31297 14-20-H62-1744,4521,4522,4554 N/A fj J UTU70814 975' FNL&936' FEL NENE, 36-iS-4W Altamont Duchesne 1(oS2,
Ute Tribal 2-22B6 43-013-31444 14-20-H62-4644 ///a¶ Ute UTU73743 1401' FSL & 1295' FWL NWSW, 15-2S-6W Altamont Duchesne IN/7ÑUte 1-15B6 43-013-31484 14-20-H62-4647 ||g/ Ute UTU73964 1879' FNL & 1070'.FEL SENE, 1-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne %ŸŸUte 1-25A3 43-013-30370 14-20-H62-1802 |¶ge , Ute N/A 172T FNL & 1784' FEL SWNE, 25-1S-3W Bluebell DuchesneUte 1-26A3 43-013-30348 14-20-H62-1803 g'fo Ute N/A 1869' FNL& 1731' FWL SENW, 26-1S-3W Bluebell



Divisio of Oil, Gas and Mining
OPERATOR CHANGEHORKSHEET °"

Attach all documentation received by the division regarding this change.
Initial each listed item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable. 3

4
Change of Operator (well sold) O Designation of Agent 5

] Designation of Operator O Operator Name Change Only 62ILM

The operator of the we11(s) listed below has changed (EFFECTIVE DATE: 12-27-95
)

TO (new operator) COASTAL OIL & GAS CORP FROM (former operator) ANR PRODUCTION CO INC
(address) PO BOX 749 (address) Pct Box 749

DENVER CO 80201-0749 DENVER CO 80201-0749

phone (303 )572-1121 phone 1303 )572-1121
account no. N 0230(B) account no. NO675

Hel l (s) (attach addi tional page i f needed) :

Name:**SEE ATTACHED** API:Û$ Ì(IŸ Entity: Sec Twp _Rng Lease Type:
Name: API:

__
Entity: Sec _Twp _ Rng_ Lease Type:

Name: API: Entity: Sec_ Twp _ Rng_ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec__ Twp Rng Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec Twp _Rng_ _ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec_ _Twp Rng_ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec_ _Twp Rng_ Lease Type:

0 ERATORCHANGRE61 lENTA

u dry or other legal documentation has been received from forrmr
operator (Attach to this form).(£,,//g.gg

2. (Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or ther legal documentation has been received from nay operator
(Attach to this form). (ß.? 3-84

3. The Department of Commerce has been contacted if the new operator above is not currently
operating any wells in Utah. Is company registered with the state? (yes/no) If
yes, show compan'y file nùmber:

4. (For Indian and Federal Hells ONLY) The BLM has been contacted regarding this change
(attach Telephone Documentation Form to this report). Make note of BLM status in
comments section of this form. Management review of Federal and Indian well operator
changes should take place prior to completion of steps 5 through 9 below.

5. Changes have been tered in e 011 a d Gas nformati n System (Wang/IBM) for each well
listed above.73-//4 (ËFNÁÁA4Í¾/54j'a[J's (F-204Á 80

6. Cardex file has been updated for each well listed above.

J. Hell file labels have been updated for each well listed above.

8. Changes have been included on the monthly "Operator, Address, and Account Changes" memo
for _distribution to State Lands and the Tax Commission. (g Lý()

TL9. A folder has been set up for the Operator Change file, and a copy of this page has been
placed there for reference during routing and processing of the original documents.

- OVER

Divisio of Oil, Gas and Mining
OPERATOR CHANGEHORKSHEET °"

Attach all documentation received by the division regarding this change.
Initial each listed item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable. 3

4
Change of Operator (well sold) O Designation of Agent 5

] Designation of Operator O Operator Name Change Only 62ILM

The operator of the we11(s) listed below has changed (EFFECTIVE DATE: 12-27-95
)

TO (new operator) COASTAL OIL & GAS CORP FROM (former operator) ANR PRODUCTION CO INC
(address) PO BOX 749 (address) Pct Box 749

DENVER CO 80201-0749 DENVER CO 80201-0749

phone (303 )572-1121 phone 1303 )572-1121
account no. N 0230(B) account no. NO675

Hel l (s) (attach addi tional page i f needed) :
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0 ERATORCHANGRE61 lENTA

u dry or other legal documentation has been received from forrmr
operator (Attach to this form).(£,,//g.gg

2. (Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or ther legal documentation has been received from nay operator
(Attach to this form). (ß.? 3-84

3. The Department of Commerce has been contacted if the new operator above is not currently
operating any wells in Utah. Is company registered with the state? (yes/no) If
yes, show compan'y file nùmber:

4. (For Indian and Federal Hells ONLY) The BLM has been contacted regarding this change
(attach Telephone Documentation Form to this report). Make note of BLM status in
comments section of this form. Management review of Federal and Indian well operator
changes should take place prior to completion of steps 5 through 9 below.

5. Changes have been tered in e 011 a d Gas nformati n System (Wang/IBM) for each well
listed above.73-//4 (ËFNÁÁA4Í¾/54j'a[J's (F-204Á 80

6. Cardex file has been updated for each well listed above.

J. Hell file labels have been updated for each well listed above.

8. Changes have been included on the monthly "Operator, Address, and Account Changes" memo
for _distribution to State Lands and the Tax Commission. (g Lý()

TL9. A folder has been set up for the Operator Change file, and a copy of this page has been
placed there for reference during routing and processing of the original documents.

- OVER



(Iþ (lþ
OPERATORCHANGEWORKSHEET (CONTINUED) Initial each item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable.

REVeEHR615-8-7)

Entity assi ments have been reviewed for all wells listed above. Were
entity changes made? (yes/ (If entity assignments were changed, attach cogies of
Form 6, Entity Action FormT.

2. State Lands and the Tax Commission have been notified through normal procedures of
entity changes.

B0pD VERIFICATION (Fee wells only) 6>s No. Il OS3gg-/ Ñ$þÐlínÁÁ c&fÂ-

} g 1. (Rule R615-3-1) The new operator of any fee lease well listed above has furnished a
proper bond.

2. A copy of this form has been placed in the new and former operators' bond files.

3. The former operator las requested a release of liability from their bond (yesžpp) __.

Today's date 794,< //, 19 . If yes, di ision response was made by letter
dated 19 .

g,,,/gs ¿Lay

LEASE INTEREST OHNERNOTIFICATION RESPONSIBILITY

l. CRule R615-2-10) The former operator/lessee of any fee lease well listed above has been
notified by letter dated 19 _, of their responsibility to notify any
person with an interest in such lease of the change of operator. Documentation of such
notification has been requested.

2. Copies of documents have been sent to State Lands for changes involving State leases.

FILMING ,

i 1. All attachments to this form have been microfilmed. Date: 19'Î7
.

FILING

1. Copies of all attachments to this form have been filed in each well file.

2. The original of this form and the original attachments have been filed in the Operator
Change

(Iþ (lþ
OPERATORCHANGEWORKSHEET (CONTINUED) Initial each item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable.

REVeEHR615-8-7)

Entity assi ments have been reviewed for all wells listed above. Were
entity changes made? (yes/ (If entity assignments were changed, attach cogies of
Form 6, Entity Action FormT.

2. State Lands and the Tax Commission have been notified through normal procedures of
entity changes.

B0pD VERIFICATION (Fee wells only) 6>s No. Il OS3gg-/ Ñ$þÐlínÁÁ c&fÂ-

} g 1. (Rule R615-3-1) The new operator of any fee lease well listed above has furnished a
proper bond.

2. A copy of this form has been placed in the new and former operators' bond files.

3. The former operator las requested a release of liability from their bond (yesžpp) __.

Today's date 794,< //, 19 . If yes, di ision response was made by letter
dated 19 .

g,,,/gs ¿Lay

LEASE INTEREST OHNERNOTIFICATION RESPONSIBILITY

l. CRule R615-2-10) The former operator/lessee of any fee lease well listed above has been
notified by letter dated 19 _, of their responsibility to notify any
person with an interest in such lease of the change of operator. Documentation of such
notification has been requested.

2. Copies of documents have been sent to State Lands for changes involving State leases.

FILMING ,

i 1. All attachments to this form have been microfilmed. Date: 19'Î7
.

FILING

1. Copies of all attachments to this form have been filed in each well file.

2. The original of this form and the original attachments have been filed in the Operator
Change



Forrn3160-5 * ED STATES FORM APPROVED
June 1990) DEPART OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993
5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 14-20-H62-1703A
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. IfIndian, Alottee or Tribe Name

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMlT" - for such proposals
Ute Indian Tribe

- Ì. If Unitor CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE N/A
1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.

OilWell Gas Well Other Potter #2-24BS
2. Name of Operator 9. APf Welt No.

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-047-31118
3. Address and Telephone No. 10. Field and Pool, Or ExploratoryArea

P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455 Altamont
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., Or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, State

2124' FSL & 922' FWL

NW/SW Section 24-T2S-R5W Duchesne County, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans

Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection

Other SWD Flowline installation Dispose water
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally
drilled,give subsurface locations and measured and truvertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent tothiswork.)*

A 2" steel SWD flowline has been installed on the subject well. All applicable damage settlements have been made.

DECElVE
APR28 1997

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINiNG

14. I hereby certify thatthe oregoing is trueand correct

Signed _ Tit! Environmental & Safety Analyst Dat 04/24/97
Sheila Bremer

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY Tit! Dat
Conditions of approval, ifany:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfullyto make to any department or agency of the United States any false, ficticious or fraudulent state ents or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse

Forrn3160-5 * ED STATES FORM APPROVED
June 1990) DEPART OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993
5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 14-20-H62-1703A
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. IfIndian, Alottee or Tribe Name

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMlT" - for such proposals

Ute Indian Tribe
- Ì. If Unitor CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE N/A
1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.

OilWell Gas Well Other Potter #2-24BS
2. Name of Operator 9. APf Welt No.

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-047-31118
3. Address and Telephone No. 10. Field and Pool, Or ExploratoryArea

P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455 Altamont
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., Or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, State

2124' FSL & 922' FWL

NW/SW Section 24-T2S-R5W Duchesne County, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans

Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection

Other SWD Flowline installation Dispose water
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally
drilled,give subsurface locations and measured and truvertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent tothiswork.)*

A 2" steel SWD flowline has been installed on the subject well. All applicable damage settlements have been made.

DECElVE
APR28 1997

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINiNG

14. I hereby certify thatthe oregoing is trueand correct

Signed _ Tit! Environmental & Safety Analyst Dat 04/24/97
Sheila Bremer

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY Tit! Dat
Conditions of approval, ifany:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfullyto make to any department or agency of the United States any false, ficticious or fraudulent state ents or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse
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Form 3160-5 ED STATES FORM APPROVED

June 1990) DEPA T OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

BUREAU LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993
5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 1¾ RE
Do not use this forrn for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. If Indian, Alottee or Tribe Name

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" - for such proposals
Ute Indian Tribe

/. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE N/A
1. Ìype of Well 8. Well Name and No.

Oil Well Gas Well Other Potter #2-24B5
2. Name of Operator 9. API Well No.

0/S
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-J)4f-31118

3. Address and Telephone No. 10. Field and Pool, Or Exploratory Area

P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455 Altamont
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., Or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, State

2124' FSL & 922' FWL

NW/SW Section 24-T2S-RSW Duchesne County, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans

Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to injection

Other Acidize Wasatch Dispose Water
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertment dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally
drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and tru vertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Please see the attached procedure for work to be performed on the subject well.

14. I hereby certifythat t going i true and correct

Signed Title Environmental & Safety Analyst oate 10/07/97
remer

(This space for Fed or Sta office u

i . . Title Date
Conditions of approval, any:

Title 18 U.S,C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, ficticious or fraudulent statements or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse

Form 3160-5 ED STATES FORM APPROVED

June 1990) DEPA T OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

BUREAU LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993
5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 1¾ RE
Do not use this forrn for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. If Indian, Alottee or Tribe Name

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" - for such proposals
Ute Indian Tribe

/. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE N/A
1. Ìype of Well 8. Well Name and No.

Oil Well Gas Well Other Potter #2-24B5
2. Name of Operator 9. API Well No.

0/S
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-J)4f-31118

3. Address and Telephone No. 10. Field and Pool, Or Exploratory Area

P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455 Altamont
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., Or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, State

2124' FSL & 922' FWL

NW/SW Section 24-T2S-RSW Duchesne County, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans

Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to injection

Other Acidize Wasatch Dispose Water
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertment dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally
drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and tru vertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Please see the attached procedure for work to be performed on the subject well.

14. I hereby certifythat t going i true and correct

Signed Title Environmental & Safety Analyst oate 10/07/97
remer

(This space for Fed or Sta office u

i . . Title Date
Conditions of approval, any:

Title 18 U.S,C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, ficticious or fraudulent statements or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse



O O

Potter #2-24BS
SECTION 24 - T2S - R5W

Duchesne Co., Utah

PROCEDURE

1) MIRU PU. NDWH. Rlse 2 3/8" sidestring. NUBOP. POOH. Rlse 7" TAC set @10,257'.
POOH w/ 2 7/8" tubing.

2) MIRU wireline. RIH w/ 4 1/8" GR/JB to PBTD @13,172'. If bridges tagged,clean out w/ 4 1/8"
mill and C/O tools.

3) RIH w/ 5" ret. pkr., 2-7/8" HD workstring, 3-1/2" 9.3#, P-110 tbg. Set pkr @l1,750'. Perfs open
above @l1,675' & below @11,760'.

4) MIRU Dowell to acidize interval from I1,760-13,134' w/ 18,000 gallons 15% HCl as per attached
treatment schedule. MTP 9,000 psi. Attempt to keep backside full. RIse pkr. PUH & reset pkr @
10,320'. PT csg to 500 psi. Hold 500 psi on backside. Acidize interval from 10,328 - 11,675' w/
15,000 gals 15%HCI as per attached procedure. MTP 9,000 psi. Note: Both jobs must be
performed in the same day.

5) Swab/flow back load and test. Rlse pkr. POOH.

6) RIH w/ pumping BHA (call Denver for BHA design). Return well to

O O

Potter #2-24BS
SECTION 24 - T2S - R5W

Duchesne Co., Utah

PROCEDURE
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Well Name: Potter #2-24B5 08ÍS: 9/22/97
Upper Stage

Fluid Stage **% KCI Gelled 10 ppg Brine 15 % Acid Vol. Ball Sealers
Description # (Gal) (Gal) (Gal) (#, So)

Pad 1 3,700
Acid 2 3,000 150

Divertor 3 2,500
Acid 4 3,500 175

Divertor 5 2,000
Acid 6 4,000 200

Divertor 7 1,500
Acid 8 4,500 225
Flush 9 5,000

Totals (gals): 8,700 6,000 15,000 750, 1.3 S.G.
(bbis): 207 143 357

Gelled Saltwater to contain: 0_ppg BAF

1_ppg Rock Salt
N_Crosslinked? \ IF140

% KCI to be determined by Mike Angus to match formation a init
På firaÏiBÑsÏrÖÑ10 (28 - ,675'

Packer set @ 10 320'

eaÏrnit down 1 2' bg 0 p I
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Fluid Stage **% KCI Gelled 10 ppg Brine 15 % Acid Vol. Ball Sealers
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Well Name: Potter #2-24B5 Date: 9/22/97
Lower Stage

Fluid Stage **% KCI Gelled 10 ppg Brine 15 % Acid Vol. Ball Sealers
Description #_ (Gal) (Gal) (Gal) (#, Sq)

Pad 1 4,300
Acid 2 3,500 175

Divertor 3 2,500
Acid 4 4,000 200

Divertor 5 2,000
Acid 6 4,500 225

Divertor 7 1,500
Acid 8 5,000 250
Flush 9 6,000

Totals (gals): 10,300 6,000 17,000 850, 1.3 S.G.
(bbis): 245 143 405

Gelled Saltwater to contain:
_0_ppg BAF

1_ppg Rock Salt
N_Crosslinked? F14 el

% KCI to be determined by Mike Angus to match formation a init
Pärf5riiBÑsfr6rn 1 I 60 - iŠ,15Ã'

1 '

ea m t down 1 2 bg 0 ) p I
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Form 3166-5 D STATES FORM APPROVED
(s'ane 1990) DEPARTA T OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993
5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS Fee
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir, 6. If indian, Alottee or Tribe Name

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT"- for such proposals
N/A

7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE N/A
1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.

Oil Well Gas Well Other POtter #2-24B5
2. Name of Operator 9. API Well No.

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-013-31118
3. Address and Telephone No. 10. Field and Pool, Or Exploratory Area

P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455 Altamont
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., Or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish. State

2124' FSL & 922' FWL

NW/SW Section 24-T2S-R5W Duchesne County, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans

Recompletian New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to injection

Other Acidize Wasatch oisposewater
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally
drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and tru vertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Please see the attached chronological history for work performed on the subject well.

DEC19 1997

DIV.0F0lL,GAS&MINING

14. I hSeirebeydcertifythat t oi nd

Titis Environmental & Safety Analyst Date 12/17/97
Sheila Bremer

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, ficticious or fraudulent statements or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse
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Page 3

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
CHRONOLOGICALHISTORY

POTTER #2-2485 (ACIDIZE WASATCH)
ALTAMONT FIELD
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH
WI: 67.38% AFE: 27395
TD: 13,200' PBTD: 13,172'
5" @13,192'-10,306'
PERFS: 10,328'-13,134'
CWC(M$): 88.5

11/19/96 POOH w/BHA.
RU, PU LD pump. ND WH,NU BOP. Unsting2%" DSS tbg, flush w/50 bbis TPW. POOH w/2¾"
tbg to 7530'. CC: $3380.

I1/20/97 WO Dowell.
SITP 30#. POOH w/2¾" DSS tbg & stinger.ND BOP. Re17"TAC @10,257'. NU BOP. Flush tbg
w/50 bbls TPW. POOH w/2¼" DSS tbg, BHA, 7" A/C. RU delsco, ran 4" GR, tagged 12,945'. RD
Delsco. WO Dowell. CC: $7741.

I1/21-24/97 WO 3½" P-110 tbg& Dowell.

I 1/25/97 WO Dowell.
Fin RIH PU 3½" tbg, set pkr @l1,742' w/35,000#. CC: $20,579.

I1/26/97 Fin POOH w/tbg & pkr.
RU Dowell. Acidize perf interval from 11,750'-13,134' w/17,000 gals 15% HCL. MTP/ATP
9032#/8500#, MTR/ATR33/25 BPM. ISIP 3772#, 10min 0. Rel pkr. POOH LD 45 jts P-110 tbg,
set 5" HD pkr ! 10,320'. Fill backside w/265 bbis TPW, will not test. Rel pkr, set @ 10,324'. Fill
backsidew/156 bbIsTPW, will not test. Rel pkr, set @10,316', pump 160bbIsTPW, will not test, RD
Dowell. Rel 5" HD pkr. POOH w/3½" P-110 tbg, EOT 7160'. Total load781 bb1s,diversion good.

CC: $91,377.

11/27-28/97 SD for holiday.

I1/29/97 PU RIH w/3½" tbg.
SITP 250#, blow well dn. Flush tbg w/30 bbis TPW. POOH w/178 jts 3½" P-110 no-go, 47 jts 2½"P-110 & 5" HD pkr, xo for 3½" P-110 tbg. PU RIH w/7" HD pkr & 2¼" SN 2¼" x 3½", xo 3½" P-
I10 tbg. EOT 8350'. CC: $101,427.

11/30/97 WO Dowell.
SITP 100#, blow well dn. RIH w/124 jts 3½" P-110 tbg, set pkr @10,242' in 35,000# comp. WO
Dowell. CC: $104,812.

12/1/97 RU Dowell.
WO Dowell, prep to acidize. CC: $104,812.

12/2/97 Swab.
SITP 700#, blow well dn. RU Dowell, acidize perf intervalsfrom 10,328'-11,675'wll500 gals 15%
HCL, diversion fair. ISIP 1100#, 5 min 0#. MTP/ATP 9100#/8400#,MTR/ATR 35/23 BPM. RD
Dowell. RU to swab,IFL 9500', swab 10BW, 0 BO, FFL 8000', total load 778 bbis. CC: $136,577.

12/3/97 POOH LD tbg.
SITP 680#, blow well dn. RU swab, IFL 8300', RD swab. Rel T' HD pkr @10,242', LD 3½" P-110
tbg, EOT 4618'. CC: $142,501.

12/4/97 RIH w/5" CIBP.
Fin POOH LD 3½" P-110 tbg, 7" HD pkr. MIRU & run temp & tracer log. Thief zone between
12,865'. Taking 150 BFPD. CC:

Page 3

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
CHRONOLOGICALHISTORY

POTTER #2-2485 (ACIDIZE WASATCH)
ALTAMONT FIELD
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH
WI: 67.38% AFE: 27395
TD: 13,200' PBTD: 13,172'
5" @13,192'-10,306'
PERFS: 10,328'-13,134'
CWC(M$): 88.5

11/19/96 POOH w/BHA.
RU, PU LD pump. ND WH,NU BOP. Unsting2%" DSS tbg, flush w/50 bbis TPW. POOH w/2¾"
tbg to 7530'. CC: $3380.

I1/20/97 WO Dowell.
SITP 30#. POOH w/2¾" DSS tbg & stinger.ND BOP. Re17"TAC @10,257'. NU BOP. Flush tbg
w/50 bbls TPW. POOH w/2¼" DSS tbg, BHA, 7" A/C. RU delsco, ran 4" GR, tagged 12,945'. RD
Delsco. WO Dowell. CC: $7741.

I1/21-24/97 WO 3½" P-110 tbg& Dowell.

I 1/25/97 WO Dowell.
Fin RIH PU 3½" tbg, set pkr @l1,742' w/35,000#. CC: $20,579.

I1/26/97 Fin POOH w/tbg & pkr.
RU Dowell. Acidize perf interval from 11,750'-13,134' w/17,000 gals 15% HCL. MTP/ATP
9032#/8500#, MTR/ATR33/25 BPM. ISIP 3772#, 10min 0. Rel pkr. POOH LD 45 jts P-110 tbg,
set 5" HD pkr ! 10,320'. Fill backside w/265 bbis TPW, will not test. Rel pkr, set @ 10,324'. Fill
backsidew/156 bbIsTPW, will not test. Rel pkr, set @10,316', pump 160bbIsTPW, will not test, RD
Dowell. Rel 5" HD pkr. POOH w/3½" P-110 tbg, EOT 7160'. Total load781 bb1s,diversion good.

CC: $91,377.

11/27-28/97 SD for holiday.

I1/29/97 PU RIH w/3½" tbg.
SITP 250#, blow well dn. Flush tbg w/30 bbis TPW. POOH w/178 jts 3½" P-110 no-go, 47 jts 2½"
P-110 & 5" HD pkr, xo for 3½" P-110 tbg. PU RIH w/7" HD pkr & 2¼" SN 2¼" x 3½", xo 3½" P-
I10 tbg. EOT 8350'. CC: $101,427.

11/30/97 WO Dowell.
SITP 100#, blow well dn. RIH w/124 jts 3½" P-110 tbg, set pkr @10,242' in 35,000# comp. WO
Dowell. CC: $104,812.

12/1/97 RU Dowell.
WO Dowell, prep to acidize. CC: $104,812.

12/2/97 Swab.
SITP 700#, blow well dn. RU Dowell, acidize perf intervalsfrom 10,328'-11,675'wll500 gals 15%
HCL, diversion fair. ISIP 1100#, 5 min 0#. MTP/ATP 9100#/8400#,MTR/ATR 35/23 BPM. RD
Dowell. RU to swab,IFL 9500', swab 10BW, 0 BO, FFL 8000', total load 778 bbis. CC: $136,577.

12/3/97 POOH LD tbg.
SITP 680#, blow well dn. RU swab, IFL 8300', RD swab. Rel T' HD pkr @10,242', LD 3½" P-110
tbg, EOT 4618'. CC: $142,501.

12/4/97 RIH w/5" CIBP.
Fin POOH LD 3½" P-110 tbg, 7" HD pkr. MIRU & run temp & tracer log. Thief zone between
12,865'. Taking 150 BFPD. CC:



Page 4

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

POTTER #2-24BS (ACIDIZE WASATCH)
ALTAMONT FIELD
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH
WI: 67.38% AFE: 27395

12/5/97 Set TAC.
MIRU Cutters. RIH w/CIBP,set @12,750'. POOH, RD Cutters. PU BHA, test cavity to 10,000#.
RU 4 Star. RIH hyd test 2½" tbg to 8500#. CC: $159,713.

12/6/97 On production.
Set TAC. RIH w/2¾" side string, ND BOP, NU WH, test to 4000#, ok. CC: $167,788.

12/7/97 Pmpd 34 BO, 218 BW, 0 MCF, 3300#, 40 SPM,20 hrs.

12/8/97 Pmpd 21 BO, 250 BW, 7 MCF, 3400#, 40 SPM, 24 hrs.

12/9/97 Pmpd 13 BO, 234 BW, 25 MCF, 3400#, 40 SPM, 24 hrs.

12/10/97 Pmpd 17 BO, 236 BW, 34 MCF, 3400#, 40 SPM, 24 hrs.

12/11/97 Pmpd 21 BO, 261 BW, 117 MCF, 3400#, 40 SPM, 24 hrs.

12/12/97 Pmpd 27 BO, 207 BW, 131 MCF, 3500#, 40 SPM, 24 hrs.

12/13/97 Pmpd 31 BO, 245 BW, 127 MCF, 3500#, 40 SPM, 24 hrs.
Prior prod: 4 BO, 46 BW, 12 MCF.
Final
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' O O
STATEOFUTAH FORM9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
OlVISION OF OlL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6.!FINDIAN.ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME;

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen exisling wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterais. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPEOFWi

OIL WELL O GAS WELL OTHER
8. WELLNAMEandNUMBER:

Exhibit "A"
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company
3. ADDRESÑÑÙÑRATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. F1ELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

468 Sonth....l?.00 East circ.Vernal STATEUtahw84078 435-789-4433
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

UTAH

n. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximale date work will start CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPA1R

CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENTOR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Dale of work completion:

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL.SITE OTHER: Name Change
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12- DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinenl details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

As a result of the merger between The Coastal Corporation and a wholly owned

subsidary of El Paso Energy Corporation, the name of Coastal. Oil & Gas Corporation

has been changed to El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company effective March 9, 2001.

See Exhibit "A"

Bond # 400JUO708
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

NAME(PLEASEPRINT Ohn T r TITLE Ÿice PreSident

SIGNATURE DATE

El Paso duction 011 & Gas Contiãn
NAME(PLEASEPRI ÃOhn T er T1TLE Vice President

SIGNATURE , DATE

(This space for ate use only RECEIVED
UN i 9 2001

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND
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State of Delaware

Office of the Secretary of State
PAGE 1

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF

DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATTACHED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT

COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF EMENDMENT OF "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION", CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION" TO "EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY", FILED IN

THIS OFFICE ON THE NINTH DAY OF MARCH, A.D. 2001, AT 11 O'CLOCK

A.M.

RECEivED

DMSION OF
IL, GAS AND MiN!NG

Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary ofState

0610204 8100 AUTHENTICATION: 1061007

010162788 DATE:
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03/09/01 10:14 FAX 713 420 4099 CORP. LAW DEPT. 003/003

CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT

OF

CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION (the "Company"), a corporationorganized and existing under and by virtue of the General Corporation Law of the State ofDelaware, DOES HEREBY CERTIFY:

FIRST: That the Board of Directors of the Company, by the unanimouswritten consent of its members, filed with the minutes of the Board, adopted a resolutionproposing and declaring advisable the foHowing amendment to the Certificate ofIncorporation of the Company:

RESOLVED that it is deemed advisable that the Certificate ofIncorporation of this Company be amended, and that said Certificate ofIncorporationbe so amended, by changing the Article thereof numbered
"FIRST." so that,as amended, said Article shall be and read as follows:

"FIRST. The name of the corporation is El Paso Production Oil & Gas
Company."

SECOND: That in lieu of a meeting and vote of stockholders, thestockholders entitled to vote have given unanimous written consent to said amendment inaccordance with the provisions of Section 228 of the General Corporation Law of theState of Delaware.

THIRD: That the aforesaid amendment was duly adopted in accordance withthe applicable provisions of Sections 242 and 228 of the General CorporationLaw of theState of Delaware.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, said COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATIONhas caused this certificate to be signed on its behalf by a Vice Presidentand attested by anAssistant Secætary, this 9th day of March 200L

COASTALOIL& GAS CORPORATION

DavidL. Siddall
Vice President

Attest:

STATE OF DELANARE
SECRETARY OF STATE

M E. R ' DIVISION OF CORPORATIONSet oark,AssistantSecretary RE ENE FILED 11:00 AN 03/09/2001
010118394 - 0610204
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH 4-KAS

2. CDWA 5-LP
3. JLT 6-FILE

Enter date after each listed item is completed

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent

Operator Name Change (Only) X Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 3-09-2001

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY
Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 RM 2975B

HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995 HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995

Phone: 1-(713)-418-4635 Phone: 1-(832)-676-4721

Account NO230 Account N1845

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)

API ENTITY SEC TWN LEASE WELL WELL
NAME NO NO RNG TYPE TYPE STATUS
2-9B5 43-013-30719 2410 09-02S-05W FEE OW S
TEW 2-10BS (CA 96-54) 43-013-31125 1756 10-02S-05W FEE OW P
FARNSWORTH 1-12B5 43-013-30124 1645 12-02S-05W FEE OW P
FARNSWORTH 2-12B5 43-013-31115 1646 12-02S-05W FEE OW S
FARNSWORTH 1-13B5 43-013-30092 1610 13-02S-05W FEE OW P
WRIGHT 2-13B5 43-013-31267 11115 13-02S-05W FEE OW P
BURTON 2-15B5 43-013-31044 10210 15-02S-05W FEE OW S
REEDER 1-17B5 43-013-30218 1710 17-02S-05W FEE OW S
HANSKUTT 2-23B5 43-013-30917 9600 23-02S-05W FEE OW P
POTTER 1-24B5 43-013-30356 1730 24-02S-05W FEE OW P
POTTER 2-24B5 43-013-31118 1731 24-02S-05W FEE OW P
MURDOCK 2-26BS 43-013-31124 1531 26-02S-05W FEE OW P
BIRCH 3-27B5 (CA 96-71) 43-013-31126 1783 27-02S-05W FEE OW P
BROWN 2-28B5 (CA 96-68) 43-013-30718 9131 28-02S-05W FEE OW P
ROBB 2-29B5 (CA 96-56) 43-013-31130 10454 29-02S-05W FEE OW P
SMITH 1-31B5 43-013-30577 1955 31-02S-05W FEE OW P
BROADHEAD 2-32B5 43-013-31036 10216 32-02S-05W FEE OW P
RHOADES MOON 1-35BS 43-013-30155 4715 35-02S-05W FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 2-35B5 43-013-30908 9404 35-02S-05W FEE OW P
RHOADES MOON 1-36B5 (CA 96-113) 43-013-30289 4765 36-02S-05W FEE OW S

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 06/19/2001

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 06/19/2001
3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 06/21/2001

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number:
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5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on: N/A

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: N/A

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator
for wells listed on: N/A

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,
for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 07/06/2001

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 07/06/2001

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 06/20/2001

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 07/06/2001

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed has furnished a bond: 400JUO708

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE

FILMING:
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on:

FILING:
1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:

COMMENTS: Master list of all wells involved in operator change from Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation to El Paso
Production Oil and Gas Company shall be retained in the "Operator Change

O O '
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1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed has furnished a bond: 400JUO708

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OlL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

FEE

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use thisform for proposals to drillnewwells, significantly deepen existingwellsbelow currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterais. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EL PASO E & P COMPANY, LP 4301331118
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1099 18TH ST SUITE 1900 DENVER STATE CO ZIP 80202 (303) 291-6417 ALTAMONT

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 922' ËWL& 21ž4FSL COUNTY: DUCHESNE

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: WWaW 4 72$ R5W STATE:
UTAH

n. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) AL1ER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

10/20/2008 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of workcompletion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS O RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EL PASO RESPECTFULLY REQUESTS APPROVAL TO RECOMPLETE THE SUBJECT WELL PER THE ATTACHED
PROCEDURE. ppf

COPYSENTTOOPERATOR

initials: MS

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) MARIEOKEEFE TITLE SR REGULATORYANALYST

SIGNATURE DATE 9/25/2008

(ThlsspaceforStateuseonly) AP#ROVED BY THE 8 1A 1 t· ·

OF UTAH DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS, AND MINING RECEIVED

DAT : SEPgg
(5/2000) o Reverse Side)

. e Oc -yt

DIVOFOiL,GAS&
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Recompletion Procedure
Potter 2-24B5

Section 24, T2S, R5W
Altamont-Bluebell Field
Duchesne County, Utah

COMPANY PERSONNEL
Title Name Office Mobile Home

Production Manager Frank Seidel (303) 291-6436 (303) 945-1049 (720) 524-8693

Production Engineer Doug Sprague (303) 291-6433 (303) 957-6176 (303) 627-4970

Production Foreman Gary Lamb (435) 454-4224 (435) 823-1443 (435) 454-3537

TUBULAR DATA
Burst Col Body Jt Drift Cap

Material Description (100%) (100%) Yield Yield ID ID CF/LF TOC

Surface 9 5/8" 36# J-55 @ 4,500' 3520 2020 564 453 8.921 8.765 .4340 SURF
Casing
Intermediate 7" 26# N-80 to 8,992' & 7240 5410 604 519 6.276 6.151 .2148 9,300'
Casing P-110 to 10,500' 9960 6210 830 693 (Top of

CBL)
Production 5" 18# P-110 @ 10,278' to 13940 13450 580 606 4.276 4.151 .0997 TOL
Liner 13,200'
Production 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 8rd & 10570 11160 2.441 2.347 .0325

Tubing 2 3/8" N-80 SS

1. MIRU workover rig. Load well with TPW.

2. ND wellhead. NU and test BOP. POOH and lay down Side string. POOH with
tubing. Lay down BHA.

3. RIH with 6 1/8" bit, 7" casing scraper and DC's and clean wellbore to top of liner
(10,278'). Circulate well clean. POOH.

4. RIH with 4 1/8" bit, 5" casing scraper and DC's and clean liner to PBD (10,400').
Circulate well clean. POOH.

5. RU EL. RIH and set 5" CIBP at 10,345'. Dump 50' of cement on top. RD EL.

6. Pressure test casing to 1,500 psi. If leak is detected, isolate with packer.
Establish breakdown. Design squeeze job based on breakdown data and

RECE ED
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squeeze leak. Drill out and test squeeze. Circulate hole clean. POOH laying
down tubing.

7. RU EL w/ 5K lubricator and test to 5,000 psi with water. RIH and shoot the
intervals of Stage # 1 per the attached schedule with 3-1/8" HSC, 22.7 gm
charges, SPF as noted and 120° phasing. Perforate first interval under 500 psig
surface pressure. Record any changes in fluid level or wellhead pressure while
perforating. RD WL unit. Lay and stake hardline to pit, NU chokes on casing
valves.

8. Pick up treating packer with circulating port and RIH with 4 ½" frac string. Set
packer at 9,850'±. Test frac string in hole to 8,500 psi.

9. MI and RU stimulation company and wellhead isolation tool.

10. Break down perforations with 5 drums of Champion paraffin chemical mixed with
20 barrels of diesel followed by 5,000 gallons 15% HCI acid at 20 to 30 bpm.
Run 90 Bio-Ball sealers (Brown or Green) evenly dispersed in the acid.
Maximum allowable surface pressure is 8,500 psi. Anticipated frac gradient
is 0.75 psilft. All fluids to contain 2% KCI substitute, scale inhibitor, biocide, and
2.0 gpt MA-844 provided by frac company. Bottom hole static temperature is
201° F at 10,056' (Mid perf). Overflush acid 10 bbis to bottom perf with 2% KCI
water. Shut down. Isolate well head and continue to monitor well head pressure
with stimulation company's data recorder for 15 minutes. Surge ball sealers.
Leave well shut in for 60 minutes total to allow Bio-Balls to dissolve. Remove
ball guns from treating line and re-pressure test treating line to 9,500 psig during
shut in period.

11. Pump the Stage # 1 crosslinked gel frac treatment with 135,000 lbs 20/40
SinterLite Bauxite per the attached schedule. All fluids to contain 2% KCI
substitute, scale inhibitor, biocide, and 2.0 gpt MA-844 provided by frac
company. Heat the treatingwater to achieve +/- 120°F the day of the frac. Tag
job with three RA isotopes. RA #1 in 100 mesh; RA #2 in 1.0 and 2.0 psa; RA #3
in 3.0 and 4.0 psa. Designed pump rate is ramped up to 60 bpm; maximum
surface pressure is to be 8,500 psi. Mark flush at 1.0 psa on wellhead
densiometer and flush to top perf. Record ISIP, 5, 10 and 15 minute pressures.
Isolate pump trucks from wellhead, rigdown isolation tool.

12. Flow test well for 24 hours recording hourly rates and pressures.

13. Open circulating port and killwell. Release treatingpacker and POOH.

14. RU EL. RIH and set 5" CBP at 9,800'. RD EL.

15. Pressure test CBP to 1,500 psi RECE D
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squeeze leak. Drill out and test squeeze. Circulate hole clean. POOH laying
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Leave well shut in for 60 minutes total to allow Bio-Balls to dissolve. Remove
ball guns from treating line and re-pressure test treating line to 9,500 psig during
shut in period.

11. Pump the Stage # 1 crosslinked gel frac treatment with 135,000 lbs 20/40
SinterLite Bauxite per the attached schedule. All fluids to contain 2% KCI
substitute, scale inhibitor, biocide, and 2.0 gpt MA-844 provided by frac
company. Heat the treatingwater to achieve +/- 120°F the day of the frac. Tag
job with three RA isotopes. RA #1 in 100 mesh; RA #2 in 1.0 and 2.0 psa; RA #3
in 3.0 and 4.0 psa. Designed pump rate is ramped up to 60 bpm; maximum
surface pressure is to be 8,500 psi. Mark flush at 1.0 psa on wellhead
densiometer and flush to top perf. Record ISIP, 5, 10 and 15 minute pressures.
Isolate pump trucks from wellhead, rigdown isolation tool.

12. Flow test well for 24 hours recording hourly rates and pressures.

13. Open circulating port and killwell. Release treatingpacker and POOH.

14. RU EL. RIH and set 5" CBP at 9,800'. RD EL.

15. Pressure test CBP to 1,500 psi RECE D
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16. RU EL w/ 5K lubricator and test to 5,000 psi with water. RIH and shoot the
intervals of Stage # 2 per the attached schedule with 3-1/8" HSC, 22.7 gm
charges, SPF as noted and 120° phasing. Perforate first interval under 500 psig
surface pressure. Record any changes in fluid level or wellhead pressure while
perforating. RD WL unit. Lay and stake hardline to pit, NU chokes on casing
valves.

17. Pick up treating packer with circulating port and RIH with 4 ½" frac string. Set
packer at 9,200'±. Test frac string in hole to 8,500 psi.

18. Mi and RU stimulation company and wellhead isolation tool.

19. Break down perforations with 5 drums of Champion paraffin chemical mixed with
20 barrels of diesel followed by 5,000 gallons 15% HCI acid at 20 to 30 bpm.
Run 150 Bio-Ball sealers (Brown or Green) evenly dispersed in the acid.
Maximum allowable surface pressure is 8,500 psi. Anticipated frac gradient
is 0.75 psilft. All fluids to contain 2% KCI substitute,scale inhibitor, biocide, and
2.0 gpt MA-844 provided by frac company. Bottom hole static temperature is193° F at 9,525' (Mid perf). Overflush acid 10 bbis to bottom perf with 2% KCI
water. Shut down. Isolate well head and continue to monitor well head pressure
with stimulation company's data recorder for 15 minutes. Surge ball sealers.
Leave well shut in for 60 minutes total to allow Bio-Balls to dissolve. Remove
ball guns from treating line and re-pressure test treating line to 9,500 psig during
shut in period.

20. Pump the Stage # 2 crosslinked gel frac treatment with 135,000 lbs 20/40
OptiProp per the attached schedule. All fluids to contain 2% KCI substitute,
scale inhibitor, biocide, and 2.0 gpt MA-844 provided by frac company. Heat the
treating water to achieve +/- 120°F the day of the frac. Tag job with three RA
isotopes. RA #1 in 100 mesh; RA #2 in 1.0 and 2.0 psa; RA #3 in 3.0 and 4.0
psa. Designed pump rate is ramped up to 55 bpm; maximum surface pressure
is to be 8,500 psi. Mark flush at 1.0 psa on wellhead densiometer and flush to
top perf. Record ISIP, 5, 10 and 15 minute pressures. Isolate pump trucks from
wellhead, rig down isolation tool.

21. Flowtest well for 24 hours recording hourly rates and pressures.

22. Open circulating port and kill well. Release treating packer and POOH laying
down 4½" frac string.

23. RIH with bit and DC's picking up tubing. Drillup CBP at 9,800' and circulate well
clean to PBD. POOH and lay down BHA.

24. Run ProTechnics TRACER LOGover frac stages.
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16. RU EL w/ 5K lubricator and test to 5,000 psi with water. RIH and shoot the
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18. Mi and RU stimulation company and wellhead isolation tool.

19. Break down perforations with 5 drums of Champion paraffin chemical mixed with
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Maximum allowable surface pressure is 8,500 psi. Anticipated frac gradient
is 0.75 psilft. All fluids to contain 2% KCI substitute,scale inhibitor, biocide, and
2.0 gpt MA-844 provided by frac company. Bottom hole static temperature is
193° F at 9,525' (Mid perf). Overflush acid 10 bbis to bottom perf with 2% KCI
water. Shut down. Isolate well head and continue to monitor well head pressure
with stimulation company's data recorder for 15 minutes. Surge ball sealers.
Leave well shut in for 60 minutes total to allow Bio-Balls to dissolve. Remove
ball guns from treating line and re-pressure test treating line to 9,500 psig during
shut in period.

20. Pump the Stage # 2 crosslinked gel frac treatment with 135,000 lbs 20/40
OptiProp per the attached schedule. All fluids to contain 2% KCI substitute,
scale inhibitor, biocide, and 2.0 gpt MA-844 provided by frac company. Heat the
treating water to achieve +/- 120°F the day of the frac. Tag job with three RA
isotopes. RA #1 in 100 mesh; RA #2 in 1.0 and 2.0 psa; RA #3 in 3.0 and 4.0
psa. Designed pump rate is ramped up to 55 bpm; maximum surface pressure
is to be 8,500 psi. Mark flush at 1.0 psa on wellhead densiometer and flush to
top perf. Record ISIP, 5, 10 and 15 minute pressures. Isolate pump trucks from
wellhead, rig down isolation tool.

21. Flowtest well for 24 hours recording hourly rates and pressures.

22. Open circulating port and kill well. Release treating packer and POOH laying
down 4½" frac string.

23. RIH with bit and DC's picking up tubing. Drillup CBP at 9,800' and circulate well
clean to PBD. POOH and lay down BHA.

24. Run ProTechnics TRACER LOGover frac stages.
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25. Run production equipment. Release all rental equipment, RD&MOrig and clean
location. Turn well over to pumper and turn to sales

Design Treatment Schedule - Stage 1

Stage Stage Type Elapse Fluid Clean Prop Prop Stage Slurry Slurry Proppant
# d Type Volume Conc Conc Prop. Rate 1 Rate 2 Type

Time (gal) 1 2 (kibs) (bpm) (bpm)
min:se (ppg) (ppg)

c
Wellbo e Fluid 2% KCL 6821

1 Main frac pad 1:35 XL 2000 0.00 0.00 0.0 30.00 30.00

2 Main frac pad 9:09 XL 14000 0.50 0.50 7.0 30.00 60.00 100-Mesh

3 Main frac pad 9:57 XL 2000 0.00 0.00 0.0 60.00 60.00

4 Main frac 15:18 XL 13000 1.00 1.00 13.0 60.00 60.00 SinterLite
slurry Bauxite

20/40
5 Main frac 22:06 XL 16000 2.00 2.00 32.0 60.00 60.00 SinterLite

slurry Bauxite
20/40

6 Main frac 28:16 XL 14000 3.00 3.00 42.0 60.00 60.00 SinterLite
slurry Bauxite

20/40
7 Main frac 33:43 XL 12000 4.00 4.00 48.0 60.00 60.00 SinterLite

slurry Bauxite
20/40

8 Main frac flush 36:15 LINEAR 20 6350 0.00 0.00 0.0 60.00 60.00

Design clean volume (bbis) 1889.3 Design proppant pumped (kibs) 142.0
Design slurry volume (bbis) 2013.9

Casing Confiquration

Length Segment Type Casing ID Casing OD Weight Grade
(ft) (in) (in) (Ib/ft)
4500 Cemented Casing 8.921 9.625 36.000 J-55

10500 Cemented Casing 6.276 7.000 26.000 N-80
2922 Cemented Casinq 4.276 5.000 18.000 P-110
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25. Run production equipment. Release all rental equipment, RD&MOrig and clean
location. Turn well over to pumper and turn to sales

Design Treatment Schedule - Stage 1

Stage Stage Type Elapse Fluid Clean Prop Prop Stage Slurry Slurry Proppant
# d Type Volume Conc Conc Prop. Rate 1 Rate 2 Type

Time (gal) 1 2 (kibs) (bpm) (bpm)
min:se (ppg) (ppg)

c
Wellbo e Fluid 2% KCL 6821

1 Main frac pad 1:35 XL 2000 0.00 0.00 0.0 30.00 30.00

2 Main frac pad 9:09 XL 14000 0.50 0.50 7.0 30.00 60.00 100-Mesh

3 Main frac pad 9:57 XL 2000 0.00 0.00 0.0 60.00 60.00

4 Main frac 15:18 XL 13000 1.00 1.00 13.0 60.00 60.00 SinterLite
slurry Bauxite

20/40
5 Main frac 22:06 XL 16000 2.00 2.00 32.0 60.00 60.00 SinterLite

slurry Bauxite
20/40

6 Main frac 28:16 XL 14000 3.00 3.00 42.0 60.00 60.00 SinterLite
slurry Bauxite

20/40
7 Main frac 33:43 XL 12000 4.00 4.00 48.0 60.00 60.00 SinterLite

slurry Bauxite
20/40

8 Main frac flush 36:15 LINEAR 20 6350 0.00 0.00 0.0 60.00 60.00

Design clean volume (bbis) 1889.3 Design proppant pumped (kibs) 142.0
Design slurry volume (bbis) 2013.9

Casing Confiquration

Length Segment Type Casing ID Casing OD Weight Grade
(ft) (in) (in) (Ib/ft)
4500 Cemented Casing 8.921 9.625 36.000 J-55

10500 Cemented Casing 6.276 7.000 26.000 N-80
2922 Cemented Casinq 4.276 5.000 18.000 P-110
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Surface Line and Tubinq Confiquration

Length Segment Type Tubing ID Tubing OD Weight Grade
(ft) (in) (in) (Ib/ft)
9850 Tubing 3.958 4.500 12.750 J-55

Total frac string volume (bbis) 162.4
Pumping down Tubing

Perforated Intervals

Interval #1 Interval #2
Top of Perfs - TVD (ft) 9912 10177
Bot of Perfs - TVD (ft) 10029 10203
Top of Perfs - MD (ft) 9912 10177
Bot of Perfs - MD (ft) 10029 10203
Perforation Diameter (in) 0.340 0.340
# of Perforations 27 36

Path Summary

Segment Length MD TVD Dev Ann OD Ann ID Pipe ID
Type (ft) (ft) (ft) (deg) | (in) (in) (in)

Tubing 9850 9850 9850 0.0 0.000 0.000 3.958
Casinq 327 10177 10177 0.0 0.000 0.000 6.276
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Surface Line and Tubinq Confiquration

Length Segment Type Tubing ID Tubing OD Weight Grade
(ft) (in) (in) (Ib/ft)
9850 Tubing 3.958 4.500 12.750 J-55

Total frac string volume (bbis) 162.4
Pumping down Tubing

Perforated Intervals

Interval #1 Interval #2
Top of Perfs - TVD (ft) 9912 10177
Bot of Perfs - TVD (ft) 10029 10203
Top of Perfs - MD (ft) 9912 10177
Bot of Perfs - MD (ft) 10029 10203
Perforation Diameter (in) 0.340 0.340
# of Perforations 27 36

Path Summary

Segment Length MD TVD Dev Ann OD Ann ID Pipe ID
Type (ft) (ft) (ft) (deg) | (in) (in) (in)

Tubing 9850 9850 9850 0.0 0.000 0.000 3.958
Casinq 327 10177 10177 0.0 0.000 0.000 6.276
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Design Treatment Schedule - Stage 2

Stage Stage Type Elapse Fluid Clean Prop Prop Stage SIurry Slurry Proppant
# d Type Volume Conc Conc Prop. Rate 1 Rate 2 Type

Time (gal) 1 2 (kibs) (bpm) (bpm)
min:se (ppg) (ppg)

c
Wellbore Fluid 2% KCL 6665

1 Main frac pad 1:35 XL 2000 0.00 0.00 0.0 30.00 30.00

2 Main frac pad 9:36 XL 14000 0.50 0.50 7.0 30.00 55.00 100-Mesh

3 Main frac pad 10:28 XL 2000 0.00 0.00 0.0 55.00 55.00

4 Main frac 16:21 XL 13000 1.00 1.00 13.0 55.00 55.00 OptiProp
slurry 20/40

5 Main frac 23:56 XL 16000 2.00 2.00 32.0 55.00 55.00 OptiProp
slurry 20/40

6 Main frac 30:50 XL 14000 3.00 3.00 42.0 55.00 55.00 OptiProp
slurry 20/40

7 Main frac 37:00 XL 12000 4.00 4.00 48.0 55.00 55.00 OptiProp
slurry 20/40

8 Main frac flush 39:39 LINEAR 20 6094 0.00 0.00 0.0 55.00 55.00

Design clean volume (bbis) 1883.2 Design proppant pumped (kibs) 142.0
Design slurry volume (bbis) 2041.0

Casing Configuration

Length Segment Type Casing ID Casing OD Weight Grade
(ft) (in) (in) (Ib/ft)
4500 Cemented Casing 8.921 9.625 36.000 J-55

50500 Cemented Casing 6.276 7.000 26.000 N-80
2922 Cemented Casinq 4.276 5.000 18.000 P-110

Surface Line and Tubinq Configuration

Length Segment Type Tubing ID Tubing OD Weight Grade
(ft) (in) (in) (Ib/ft)
9200 Tubing 3.958 4.500 12.750 J-55

Total frac string volume (bbls) 158.7
Pumping down Tubing
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Design Treatment Schedule - Stage 2

Stage Stage Type Elapse Fluid Clean Prop Prop Stage SIurry Slurry Proppant
# d Type Volume Conc Conc Prop. Rate 1 Rate 2 Type

Time (gal) 1 2 (kibs) (bpm) (bpm)
min:se (ppg) (ppg)

c
Wellbore Fluid 2% KCL 6665

1 Main frac pad 1:35 XL 2000 0.00 0.00 0.0 30.00 30.00

2 Main frac pad 9:36 XL 14000 0.50 0.50 7.0 30.00 55.00 100-Mesh

3 Main frac pad 10:28 XL 2000 0.00 0.00 0.0 55.00 55.00

4 Main frac 16:21 XL 13000 1.00 1.00 13.0 55.00 55.00 OptiProp
slurry 20/40

5 Main frac 23:56 XL 16000 2.00 2.00 32.0 55.00 55.00 OptiProp
slurry 20/40

6 Main frac 30:50 XL 14000 3.00 3.00 42.0 55.00 55.00 OptiProp
slurry 20/40

7 Main frac 37:00 XL 12000 4.00 4.00 48.0 55.00 55.00 OptiProp
slurry 20/40

8 Main frac flush 39:39 LINEAR 20 6094 0.00 0.00 0.0 55.00 55.00

Design clean volume (bbis) 1883.2 Design proppant pumped (kibs) 142.0
Design slurry volume (bbis) 2041.0

Casing Configuration

Length Segment Type Casing ID Casing OD Weight Grade
(ft) (in) (in) (Ib/ft)
4500 Cemented Casing 8.921 9.625 36.000 J-55

50500 Cemented Casing 6.276 7.000 26.000 N-80
2922 Cemented Casinq 4.276 5.000 18.000 P-110

Surface Line and Tubinq Configuration

Length Segment Type Tubing ID Tubing OD Weight Grade
(ft) (in) (in) (Ib/ft)
9200 Tubing 3.958 4.500 12.750 J-55

Total frac string volume (bbls) 158.7
Pumping down Tubing
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Perforated Intervals

Interval #1 Interval #2 Interval #3 Interval #4 Interval #5
Top of Perfs - TVD (ft) 9334 9398 9482 9594 __9688

Bot of Perfs - TVD (ft) 9372 9428 9525 9637 9716
Top of Perfs - MD (ft) 9334 9398 9482 9594 9688
Bot of Perfs - MD (ft) 9372 9428 9525 9637 9716
Perforation Diameter (in) 0.340 0.340 0.340 0.340 0.340
# of Perforations 16 12 30 27 12

Path Summary

Segment Length MD TVD Dev Ann OD Ann ID Pipe ID
Type (ft) (ft) (ft) (deg) (in) (in) (in)

Tubing 9200 9200 9200 0.0 0.000 0.000 3.958
Casing 488 | 9688 9688 0.0 0.000 0.000 6.276
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Perforated Intervals

Interval #1 Interval #2 Interval #3 Interval #4 Interval #5
Top of Perfs - TVD (ft) 9334 9398 9482 9594 __9688

Bot of Perfs - TVD (ft) 9372 9428 9525 9637 9716
Top of Perfs - MD (ft) 9334 9398 9482 9594 9688
Bot of Perfs - MD (ft) 9372 9428 9525 9637 9716
Perforation Diameter (in) 0.340 0.340 0.340 0.340 0.340
# of Perforations 16 12 30 27 12

Path Summary

Segment Length MD TVD Dev Ann OD Ann ID Pipe ID
Type (ft) (ft) (ft) (deg) (in) (in) (in)

Tubing 9200 9200 9200 0.0 0.000 0.000 3.958
Casing 488 | 9688 9688 0.0 0.000 0.000 6.276
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Potter 2-24B5
PERFORATIONSCHEDULE - GREEN RIVERFORMATION

Cased Hole Reference Log: OWP CBL - 11/15/85

2008 Recompletion Perfs - Stage 1

Depth Depth SPF Cum Shots Depth Depth SPF Cum Shots Depth Depth SPF Cum Shots

9,910 9,911 1 1

9,926 9,927 1 2

9,931 9,932 1 3

9,939 9,942 1 6

9,945 9,949 1 10

9,962 9,963 1 11

9,968 9,969 1 12

9,976 9,977 1 13

9,979 9,980 1 14

9,983 9,986 1 17

9,988 9,989 1 18

9,993 9,994 1 19

10,000 10,001 1 20

10,003 10,004 1 21

10,007 10,008 1 22

10,011 10,012 1 23

10,015 10,016 1 24

10,020 10,021 1 25

10,027 10,028 1 26

10,177 10,179 6 38

10,182 10,183 6 44

10,184 10,185 6 50

10,187 10,188 6 56

10,201 10,202 6



Potter 2-24B5
PERFORATION SCHEDULE - GREEN RIVERFORMATION

Cased Hole Reference Log: OWP CBL - 11/15/85

2008 Recompletion Perfs - Stage 2

Depth Depth SPF Cum Shots Depth Depth SPF Cum Shots Depth Depth SPF Cum Shots
9,326 9,327 2 2

9,329 9,330 2 4

9,341 9,342 2 6

9,345 9,346 2 8

9,351 9,352 2 10

9,359 9,361 2 14

9,363 9,364 2 16

9,391 9,392 2 18

9,394 9,395 2 20

9,403 9,404 2 22

9,411 9,412 2 24

9,416 9,417 2 26

9,421 9,422 2 28

9,477 9,478 6 34

9,481 9,482 6 40

9,487 9,488 6 46

9,511 9,512 6 52

9,519 9,520 6 58

9,591 9,592 3 61

9,597 9,598 3 64

9,610 9,611 3 67

9,613 9,614 3 70

9,617 9,618 3 73

9,621 9,622 3 76

9,625 9,626 3 79

9,627 9,628 3 82

9,633 9,634 3 85

9,686 9,687 4 89

9,707 9,708 4 93

9,714 9,715 4
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9,633 9,634 3 85

9,686 9,687 4 89

9,707 9,708 4 93

9,714 9,715 4



O
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER POTTER 2-24B5
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EL PASO E & P COMPANY, LP 4301331118
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1099 18TH ST SUITE 1900
CITY

DENVER STATE CO ZIP 80202 (303) 291-6417 ALTAMONT
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 922' FWL & 2124 FSL COUNTY: DUCHESNE

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:NWSW 24 T2S R5W STATE:
UTAH

ii. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEM REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER:
12/31/2008 O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly stiow all pertinent details including dates, depttis, volutnes, etc.

EL PASO performed well work 11/22/08-12/31/08. perforated and frac'd according to approved procedure.
11/26 Set CIBP @10318',dump ball 20' cmt on CIBP.
12/2 Perf 10202 - 9910' 62 holes.
12/6 Frac 10202-9910' See attached.
12/9 CSP @ 9800
12/10 Perf 9715 - 9326' 97 shots
12/13 FracPmpd 4998 gal 15% HCL; AVG press 4371 psi. Pmpd 5145 Ibs 100 Mesh, 60765 lbs 20/40 sinterlite RD
Weatherford.
12/16 RIH w/ coiled tbg tag @5000'washed sand out to 9350' circ clean. POOH coil tbg.
12/17-12-20 tryto clean tbg and sand out.
12/21 tag sand @955610' fill overnight Drl thruCBP @9800'circ tbg clean
12/22-24 still sanding up. Run protech tracer Iog 10220-9100' cleaned up.
12/25 2-7/8" EOT 9309', PSN 9206', TAC 8984'
12/30 Flush tbgw/60bbis 2% KCL 30 bbis brine. Run rods and pump. POP

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) MARIEOKEEFE TITLE SR REGULATORY ANALYST

SIGNATURE DATE 3/5/2009

(ThisspaceforStateuseonly) RECEIVED
MAR1O2009

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side) DIV.OFOlL,GAS&MI
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12/10 Perf 9715 - 9326' 97 shots
12/13 FracPmpd 4998 gal 15% HCL; AVG press 4371 psi. Pmpd 5145 Ibs 100 Mesh, 60765 lbs 20/40 sinterlite RD
Weatherford.
12/16 RIH w/ coiled tbg tag @5000'washed sand out to 9350' circ clean. POOH coil tbg.
12/17-12-20 tryto clean tbg and sand out.
12/21 tag sand @955610' fill overnight Drl thruCBP @9800'circ tbg clean
12/22-24 still sanding up. Run protech tracer Iog 10220-9100' cleaned up.
12/25 2-7/8" EOT 9309', PSN 9206', TAC 8984'
12/30 Flush tbgw/60bbis 2% KCL 30 bbis brine. Run rods and pump. POP

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) MARIEOKEEFE TITLE SR REGULATORY ANALYST

SIGNATURE DATE 3/5/2009

(ThisspaceforStateuseonly) RECEIVED
MAR1O2009

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side) DIV.OFOlL,GAS&MI



08111811011¶ Fracturing Technologies

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY
Weatherford Fracturing Technologies provided the following Fracture Stimulation treatment on December É,2008
with the following results for:

Company: El Paso Ticket Number:
Well: Potter 2-24B5 72543-503
API Number: 43-013-31118
County & State: Duchesne Co, Ut
Sec. / Twp. / Rng. Sec 24 - T2S - R5W
Zone: 1
Formation: Lower Green River
Top Perf: 9,910 ft /
Bottom Perf: 10,202 ft /
Fluid System: DynaFrac HT
Base Fluid: 8.36 lb/gal

ACID AVGIMAX FRAC AVGIMAX
Avg. Rate: 24.4 bpm Avg. Rate: 59.2

Avg. Pressure: 4,302 psi Avg. Pressure: 6,069
Max Rate: 35.5 bpm Max Rate: 63.9

Max Pressure: 7,175 psi Max Pressure: 8,112
Avg. HP 2,573 HP Avg. HP 8,806
Max HP: 6,243 HP Max HP: 12,705

Total Pad & SLF Pumped: 41,026 gal 977 bbis
Total 15% HCL Acid Pumped: 5,754 gal 137 bbis
Total Fluid Pumped: 62,358 ga\ 1485 bbis
Total Proppant in Formation: 36,669 Ibs
Total Proppant Pumped: 7,600 lbs (100 Mesh)
Total Proppant Pumped: 30,816 Ibs (20/40 Sinterlite)

Acid ISIP: 673 psi
5 Min : 289 psi
10 Min : 210 psi
15 Min : 165 psi

Final ISIP: 6,685 psi
5 Min : 5449 psi
10 Min : 5194 psi
15 Min : 5025 psi
Net Pessure Change: 6,012 psi
Initial Frac Gradient: 0.50 psilft
Final Frac Gradient: 1.10 psilft

Pressure tested to 9235 PSI.
Max Pressure set by company representative at 8500 PSI.
Injected 14 bbis of diesel ahead of acid stage.
Had to shut-down treatment in 2 PPA stage due to pressure.
Underflushed by approximately 20.8 bbis and 1,747 Ibs of Sinterlite in wellbore.
The treatment was successfully flushed to top perf.
Please feel free to contact me at (435) 828-3726 if you have any questions or concerns.
Thank you.

David Arnold
District Engineer
Weathford Fracturing
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: POTTER 2-24B5
Common Well Name: l'OTTER 2-24B5 Spud Date: 8/5/1985
Event Name: ItECOMPLETION Start: 11/21/2008 End:
Contractor Name: IIASIC Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: IIASIC Rig Number: 1474

SubDate From - To Hours Code Code Phase Description of Operations

11/22/2008 07:00 -17:30 10.50 C HSM RU RIG 1000 PSI ON CSG &TBG. BLED DOWN WELL TO PIT.
RAN PUMP LINES PUMPED 50 BBLS DOWN CSG. NU DOWN WH.
WH WAS STUCK WORK FREE.NU BOPS RU RIG FLOOR,FLUSH
TBG Wl20 BBLS. LD 100 JTS 2 3/8 DSS HT TBG EOT @6744'
SWIFN 5:30 70 BBLS
TPW

11/23/2008 - NO ACTIVITY
11/24/2008 - NO ACTIVITY
11/25/2008 07:00 -17:00 10.00 C HSM 900 TS\P, 900 CSIP, BLED DOWN WELL. PUMPED 30 BBLS

DOWN CSG, 15 BBLS DOWN TBG. CONTINUED TOOH Wl23/8 DSS
HT TBG 214 JTS &STINGER WHILE PUMMPING 35BBLS DOWN
CSG TO KEEP GAS DOWN. CHG OVER TO PULL 2 7/8 TBG.
RELEASED TAC, TBG STANDING FULLTRIED TO FLUSH TBG
PRESS TO 2000 PSI. TOOH W/ 68 JTS 27/8 DSS HT TBG. SWIFN
5:00

80 BBLS TPW
DAILY 150 BBLS TPW TOTAL

11/26/2008 07:00 - 17:30 10.50 C HSM 500 CSIP 0 TSIP. BLED DOWN WELL PUMPED 50BBLS DOWN
CSG. FINISHED TOOH Wl259 JTS OF 2 7/8 DSS HT TBG,
X-OVER,TRICO 220 PC, 7-JTS 2 7/8 N80 EUE, 4' TBG SUB, 4 1/2
PBGA 1-JT27/8 N80 EUE,27/8 SOLID PLUG, 1 PERF JT, 6' TBG
SUB, 7" TAC. RU WIRELINE. RIH W/ 4" GR/JB TO@10350'. RIH WI 5"
CIBP MISFIRE. POOH WICIBP REBlULT FIRING HEAD. RIH Wl5"

D RD
WIRELINE SWIFN 5:30

11/27/2008 07:00 - 17:00 10.00 C HSM 200 CSIP. BLED DOWN WELL, FILLEDCSG 273 BTPW FLUID
LEVEL7127'. PRESS TEST @1500 PSI HELDW/ SURF CSG OPEN.
RIH Wl27/8 COLLAR, 6-JTS 2 /78 EUE, X-OVER, 322 JTS 2 7/8 DSS
HT. LD 272 JTS 27/8. EOT @ 1707, SWIFN 5:00

DAILY273 BTPW CUMM 473 BTPW
11/28/2008 - NO ACTIVITY
11/29/2008 - NO ACTIVITY
11/30/2008 - NO ACTIVTY
12/1/2008 - NO ACTIVITY
12/2/2008 07:00 -17:30 10.50 C HSM OTSIP OCSIP FINISHED LD 76 JTS 2/78 DSS TBG & 6 JTS 27/8

N-80 EUE. RD RIG FLOOR.FILLED CSG Wl22 BBLS 2%KCL. ND BOP
RlH WI7" ARROW SET PKR 1-JT 27/6 CIRC WELL Wl5 BBLS. SET
PKR @20'.CUT OFF ALIGNMENT PIN. RELEASED PKR. LD 1-JT &
PKR NU BOPS. RU PERF-O-LOG MADE2 PERF. RUNS
PERFORATED FROM 10202 TO 9910' 62 HOLES.,RD WIRELINERS.
CHG OVER TO RUN 4 1/2 TBG. RIH WI T HD PKR,X-OVER, &35 JTS
41/2 P110 EUE TBG EOT @1175'SWIFN 5:30

DAILY22 BBLS 2% CUMM495 BBLS
12/3/2008 07:00 - 17:00 10.00 C 7:00 HSM OTSIP OCSIP CIRC WELL WI 30 BBLS. RIH W/ 209 JTS 4

1/2 P-110 EUE TBG STOPPING &CIRC, WATER AS NEEDED TO
KEEP OIL IN TBG.(150 BBLS OF 2%KCL) DISPLACING FLUID IN
CELLAR SWIFN 5:00 EOT @6601'

Printed: 3/4/2009 9:18:54
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EL PASO PRODUCTION Page 2 of 4

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: POTTER 2-24BS
Common Well Name: POTTER 2-24BS Spud Date: 8/5/1985
Event Name: RECOMPLETION Start: 11/21/2008 End:
Contractor Name: BASIC Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: BASIC Rig Number: 1474

SubDate From - To Hours Code Code Phase Description of Operations

12/3/2008 07:00 - 17:00 10.00 C
DAILY0 BBLS CUMM 495BBLS

12/4/2008 07:00 - 15:00 8.00 C 7:00 HSM OCSIP OTSIP. CONTINUED INWELL Wl4 1/2 P-110 EUE,
TOTAL OF 291 JTS SET PKR @9179'.FILLEDCSG Wl0 BBLS.
PRESS TEST @ 1500 PSI LOST 150 PSI IN 15 MIN. RU FLOW
LINE.SWIFN 3:00

DAILYOBBLS
CUMM495 BBLS

12/5/2008 - NO ACTIVITY
12/6/2008 07:00 -15:30 8.50 C HSM OCSIP 930 TSlP WEATHERFORD RU TO FRAC. PRESS TEST

LINES TO@9235 PSI. OPENED UP TBG 930 PSI. PUMPED 14BBLS
OF DIESEL TREATED W/ CHAMPION PARRIFIN SOLVENT.PUMPED
5754 GAL 15%HCL ACID. AVG RATE 24.4 BPM, AVG PRESSURE
4302 PSI,MAX RATE 35.5BPM,MAX PRESS.7175. ISIP 673, 5 MIN289,
10 MIN210, 15MIN 165. SURGE WELL WAITED 45MINS START
FRAC. PUMPED PAD PUMPED 7600 LBS 100 MESH, 30816 LBS OF
20/40 SINTERLITE.HAD TO SHUT DOWN FRAC IN 2 LBS STAGE
SCREENED OUT FLUSH TBG W/ 146 BBLS OF TREATED 2% KCL.
AVG RATE 59.2 BPM AVG PRESS. 6089. MAXRATE 63.9 BPM MAX
PRESS 8112. ISIP 6685, 5MIN 5449, 10MIN5194, 15MIN5025. SWl.
RD WEATHERFORD. RU FLOW BACK LINES OPENED AFTER
SHUT IN FOR 1 HR &55 MINS. TBG PRESS 3500 PSI OPENED WELL
FLOWED 27 BBLS THEN DIED. SWlFN 3:30

DAILY1485 F
CUMM 1978

12/7/2008 07:00 -16:00 9.00 C HSM OTSIP OCSIP RU DELSCO TAGGED FILL@9898'. RD SLICK
LINE. RELEASED 7" HD PKR REVERSE ClRC W/ 150 BBLS 2%KCL
TOOH Wl221 JTS 4 1/2 EUE TBG SWIFN EOT 2221' 3:00

DAILY0 BBLS CUMM 1978 BBLS

12/8/2008 - NO ACTIVITY
12/9/2008 07:00 -17:30 10.50 C HSM OTSIP 0 CSIP CIRC WELL Wl75 BBLS 2% KCL LD70 JTS 41/2

EUE TBG & 7" HD PKR. RU PERF-O-LOG. RIH Wl5.875 GR/JB TO @
9860'. RIH AND SET 7"CBP@ 9800'. RIH DUMPED BAILED2 SACKS
OF SAND(9') RD WIRELINE SWIFN 5:30

12/10/2008 07:00 -17:00 10.00 C HSM FILLED CSG W / 3 BBLS 2% KCL PRESS TEST CSG @1500 |
PSI HELD U WIRELINE MADE 3 RUNS. PERFORATED FROM 9715'
TO 9326 97 SHOTS. RD WlREL\NE. RIH WI T' HD PKR & 130 JTS 4
1/2 EUE TBG. CIRC ASNEEDED TO KEEP OIL INWELL. EOT @4116'
SWIFN 5:00

DAILY3 BBLS 2% CUMM 1981 BBLS WI FRAC
12/11/2008 07:00 -15:30 8.50 C HSM 100 TSIP 100CSIP BLED DOWN WELL CIRC 20 BBLS BRINE

DOWN TBG. FINISHED RIH Wl161 JTS 4 1/2 EUE TBG. SET PKR @
9179' FILED CSG Wl0 BBLS PRESS TEST @ 1500 PSI LOST 300 PSI
IN 10 MIN. RELEASED PKR LD 1JT 4 1/2 TBG SET PKR 9147 PRESS
TEST CSG 1500 PSI LOST 300 PSI IN 10 MIN. DECIDED TO FRAC.
SWIFN

DAILY0 BBLS CUMM 1981 WI FRAC

12/12/2008 - NO ACTVITY
12/13/2008 07:00 -17:30 10.50 C HSM RU WEATHERFORD FOR FRAC.PRESS TEST LINES TO 9000

Printed: 3/4/2009 9:18:54
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: POTTER 2-24B5
Common Well Name: POTTER 2-24B5 Spud Date: 8/5/1985
Event Name: RECOMPLETION Start: 11/21/2008 End:
Contractor Name: BASIC Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: BASIC Rig Number: 1474

SubDate From - To Hours Code Code . Phase Description of Operations

12/13/2008 07:00 -17:30 10.50 C PSI HELD. OTSIP 0 CSIP HELD 700 PSI ON ANN. Wl RIG PUMP
THRU FRAC. PUMPED 20 BBLS DIESEL TREATED WI PARRIFIN
SOL. PUMPED 4998 GAL 15% HCL ACID.( BROKE AT 3017) AVG
RATE 21.3 BPM, AVG PRESS 4371 PSI MAXRATE 3208 BPM MAX
PRESS 7459 PSI. ISIP1691,5 MIN 1250, 10 MIN 1100,15 MIN999.
SURGED WELL WAITED 1HR. OPENED UP TBG 630 PSI. PUMPED
5145 LBS 100 MESH.60765 LBS 20/40 SINTERLITE. SCREENED OUT
ATSTART OF 3# STAGE TRIED TO FLUSH TBG 39 BBLS SHORT OF
TP PERF. ISIP 6592,5 MIN4743,10 MIN 4644, 15MIN 4512. RD
WEATHERFORD. RU FLOW BACK LINE. OPENED TBG AT 5:00 3700
PSI SDFN 5:30

1665 BBLS DAILY 3646 BBLS CUMM
12/14/2008 07:00 -11:00 4.00 C HSM RD DOWN FLOW BACK LINE RU DELSCO TAGGED FILL

@4930'RD DELSCO SWIFN 11:00
12/15/2008 00:00 - NO ACTIVITY
12/16/2008 07:00 -19:00 12.00 C HSM RU COIL TBG RIH TAGGED @5000' WASHED SAND OUT TO

@9350CIRC CLEANWl2BPM &NITIOGEN. POOH WI COIL TBG RD
COIL TBG UNIT. SWIFN

215 BBLS DAILY3899 CUMMW/
FRACS

12/17/2008 07:00 -17:00 10.00 C HSM 500 TSIP 100 CSIP BLED DOWN TBG. PUT 500 PSI ON ANN.
RELEASED PKR CIRC WELL /300 BBLS OF HOT 2% KCL. ND FRAC
VALVE.WAITED FOR SCAN TECH RU SCAN TECH. RENTED
TONGS DIDN'TWORK WAITED FOR WEATHERFORD RU.
INSPECTED & LD 39 JTS OF 4 1/2 EUE TBG EOT 7920' SWIFN 5:00

DAILY 0 BBLS 3899 BBLS WI FRACS
12/18/2008 07:00 -17:30 10.50 C HSM OTSIP 0 CSIP RU CSG TONGS. PUMPED 10 BBLS GOTCIRC.

CIRC CLEAN Wl30 BBLS HOT2% KCL. RU SCAN TECH. LD&
INSPECTED 200 JTS OF 4 1/2 EUE. EOT @1682'SWIFN 5:30

DAILY10 BBLS CUMM.3909 BBLS W/ FRACS
12/19/2008 08:00 - 17:30 9.50 C HSM OTSIP OCSIP FILED WELL ORE W/ 15 BBLS CIRC CLEAN W/ 40

BBLS. LD & INSPECTED 50 JTS 4 1/2 EUE TBG. RD WESTATES RD
SCAN TECH. RIH Wl6 1/8 BIT, BIT SUB 1 JT 2 7/8 N-80 EUE,SN, 6
JTS 2 7/8 EUE,X-OVER, 97 JTS 27/8 DSS,EOT @3053,DRAINED
PUMP &LINES SWIFN 5:30

DAILY10 BBLS CUMM3919 BBLS WIFRACS
12/20/2008 07:00 -17:30 10.50 C HSM 0 TSIP 0 CSIP. CONTINUED PU 2 7/8 TBG 174 JTS DSS

X-OVER. 31 JTS 27/8 EUETAGGED SAND 9450' RU POWER
SWIVEL. PUMPED 0 BBLS GOT CIRC CLEANED OUT SAND TO
@9566CIRC TBG CLEAN . PUMPED 15 BBLS BRINE TO KILLTBG.
TOOH W/ 10 JTS 27/8 N-80 EUE EOT @ 9250. SWIFN 5:30

DAILY150 BBLS CUMM4069
BBLS WI FRACS

12/21/2008 07:00 -17:30 10.50 C HSM 120 TSIP 120 CSIP BLED DOWN WELL TAGGED SAND @9556
(10' FILLOVER NIGHT) WASHED OUT SAND TO CBP @9827 SLM
DRILLEDTHRU CBP CIRC TBG CLEAN TOOH Wl20 JTS 27/8 TBG

Printed: 3/4/2009 9:18:54
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PRESS 7459 PSI. ISIP1691,5 MIN 1250, 10 MIN 1100,15 MIN999.
SURGED WELL WAITED 1HR. OPENED UP TBG 630 PSI. PUMPED
5145 LBS 100 MESH.60765 LBS 20/40 SINTERLITE. SCREENED OUT
ATSTART OF 3# STAGE TRIED TO FLUSH TBG 39 BBLS SHORT OF
TP PERF. ISIP 6592,5 MIN4743,10 MIN 4644, 15MIN 4512. RD
WEATHERFORD. RU FLOW BACK LINE. OPENED TBG AT 5:00 3700
PSI SDFN 5:30

1665 BBLS DAILY 3646 BBLS CUMM
12/14/2008 07:00 -11:00 4.00 C HSM RD DOWN FLOW BACK LINE RU DELSCO TAGGED FILL

@4930'RD DELSCO SWIFN 11:00
12/15/2008 00:00 - NO ACTIVITY
12/16/2008 07:00 -19:00 12.00 C HSM RU COIL TBG RIH TAGGED @5000' WASHED SAND OUT TO

@9350CIRC CLEANWl2BPM &NITIOGEN. POOH WI COIL TBG RD
COIL TBG UNIT. SWIFN

215 BBLS DAILY3899 CUMMW/
FRACS

12/17/2008 07:00 -17:00 10.00 C HSM 500 TSIP 100 CSIP BLED DOWN TBG. PUT 500 PSI ON ANN.
RELEASED PKR CIRC WELL /300 BBLS OF HOT 2% KCL. ND FRAC
VALVE.WAITED FOR SCAN TECH RU SCAN TECH. RENTED
TONGS DIDN'TWORK WAITED FOR WEATHERFORD RU.
INSPECTED & LD 39 JTS OF 4 1/2 EUE TBG EOT 7920' SWIFN 5:00

DAILY 0 BBLS 3899 BBLS WI FRACS
12/18/2008 07:00 -17:30 10.50 C HSM OTSIP 0 CSIP RU CSG TONGS. PUMPED 10 BBLS GOTCIRC.

CIRC CLEAN Wl30 BBLS HOT2% KCL. RU SCAN TECH. LD&
INSPECTED 200 JTS OF 4 1/2 EUE. EOT @1682'SWIFN 5:30

DAILY10 BBLS CUMM.3909 BBLS W/ FRACS
12/19/2008 08:00 - 17:30 9.50 C HSM OTSIP OCSIP FILED WELL ORE W/ 15 BBLS CIRC CLEAN W/ 40

BBLS. LD & INSPECTED 50 JTS 4 1/2 EUE TBG. RD WESTATES RD
SCAN TECH. RIH Wl6 1/8 BIT, BIT SUB 1 JT 2 7/8 N-80 EUE,SN, 6
JTS 2 7/8 EUE,X-OVER, 97 JTS 27/8 DSS,EOT @3053,DRAINED
PUMP &LINES SWIFN 5:30

DAILY10 BBLS CUMM3919 BBLS WIFRACS
12/20/2008 07:00 -17:30 10.50 C HSM 0 TSIP 0 CSIP. CONTINUED PU 2 7/8 TBG 174 JTS DSS

X-OVER. 31 JTS 27/8 EUETAGGED SAND 9450' RU POWER
SWIVEL. PUMPED 0 BBLS GOT CIRC CLEANED OUT SAND TO
@9566CIRC TBG CLEAN . PUMPED 15 BBLS BRINE TO KILLTBG.
TOOH W/ 10 JTS 27/8 N-80 EUE EOT @ 9250. SWIFN 5:30

DAILY150 BBLS CUMM4069
BBLS WI FRACS

12/21/2008 07:00 -17:30 10.50 C HSM 120 TSIP 120 CSIP BLED DOWN WELL TAGGED SAND @9556
(10' FILLOVER NIGHT) WASHED OUT SAND TO CBP @9827 SLM
DRILLEDTHRU CBP CIRC TBG CLEAN TOOH Wl20 JTS 27/8 TBG

Printed: 3/4/2009 9:18:54



EL PASO PRODUCTION Page 4 of 4

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: l'OTTER 2-24B5
Common Well Name: l'OTTER 2-24B5 Spud Date: 8/5/1985
Event Name: ItECOMPLETION Start: 11/21/2008 End:
Contractor Name: IlASIC Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: IlASIC Rig Number: 1474

SubDate From - TO Hourš Code Code Phase Description of Operationà

12/21/2008 07:00 - 17:30 10.50 C EOT9225 DRAINED PUMP &LINES 5:30

150 BBLS CUMM 4219 WI FRACS
12/22/2008 - NO ACTIVITY
12/23/2008 07:00 - 17:00 10.00 C HSM OTSIP CSG FLOWING . RIH TAGGED @9890' RU POWER

SWIVEL PUMPED 0 BBLS GOT CIRC. RAN INTO REMAINS OF CBP
UNABLETO WASH SAND PUMPING DOWN CSG. REVERSED
PUMPING WASHED DOWN TO L.T. @10284SLM. CIRC CSG CLEAN
WI400 BBLS POOH Wl35 JTS 27/8 EUE TBG EOT @9190' SWIFN
5:00

DAILY200 BBLS CUMM4419 BBLS WIFRACS
12/24/2008 07:30 - 16:30 9.00 C HSM OTSIP CSG FLOWING RIH W/ 35 JTS TO LT 10284 SLM LD 1 JT

27/8 EUE EOT @ 10253'. RU DELSCO TO RUN PROTECH TRACER
LOG RIH. LOGGED FROM 10220 TO 9100. POOH W/ WIRELINE RD
DELSCO DOWNLOAD LOG INFORMATION. RD DELSCO LD34 JTS 2
7/8 POOH Wl218 JTS 2 7/8 TBG EOT @2509 SWIFN 4:30

DAILY0 BBLS CUMM4419 BBLS W/ FRAC
12/25/2008 07:30 -14:30 7.00 C HSM OTSIP CSG FLOWING TOOH Wl82 JTS 27/8 TBG, BITSUB, BIT.

RIH W/ SOLIDPLUG,5 3/4 NO-GO,2-JTS 27/8 N-80 EUE, 4 1/2 PBGA,
4' TBG SUB,PSN,7-JTS 27/8 N-80 EUE,7" TAC, 1-JT 27/8 EUE
TBG,X-OVER,270 JTS 27/8 DSS HT TBG,X-OVER,23-JTS 77/A N-80
EUE TBO.SET TAC ©ß984' Wl25K TENSION, PSN @9206', EOT
93QB.RD RIG FLOOR ND BOPS NU WELLHEAI.)PLUMB IN FLOW
LINE. CHG OVER TO RUN RODS SWIFN 2:30

DAILY0 BBLS CUMM4419 WIFRACS
12/26/2008 - NO ACTIVITY
12/27/2008 - NO ACTIVITY
12/28/2008 - NO ACTIVITY
12/29/2008 - NO ACTIITY
12/30/2008 07:30 - 18:00 10.50 C HSM 7:30-8:00 WAIT ON PUMPER TO OPEN TREATER

8:00 -10:OO FLUSH TBG Wl60 BBLS 2% KCL & 30 BBLS BRINE
10:00-5:30 PU & PRIMED 2 1/2"X 1 3/4"X 36' RHBC PUMP RIH WI
PUMP, 24-1" WlG,104-3/4"(54-WlG,40-SLK,10-WlG) 112-7/8
(50-WIG,52-SLK,10-WlG) 124-1" (10-WlG, 114-SLK)
5:30-6:00 SPACED OUT RODS W/ 1-1"X2' SUB PU POLISH ROD
FILLEDTBG Wl0 BBLS PRESS & STORKE TEST TO 1000 PSI HELD
SDFN 6:00

0 BBLS CUMM 4419 BBLS W/ FRACS
12/31/2008 07:30 -11:00 3.50 C HSM 7:30 -11:00 RD RIG RACKED OUT PUMP CLEAN LOC

GOTREADY TO MOVE

Printed: 3/4/2009 9:18:54
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STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 POTTER 2-24B5 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43013311180000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2124 FSL 0922 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.0S Range: 05.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

4/29/2011

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: convert to ESP

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 El Paso converted to ESP. See attached report.  

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Marie Okeefe 303 291-6417

TITLE
 Sr Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 5/3/2011

05/03/2011

May. 03, 2011

Sundry Number: 14724 API Well Number: 43013311180000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
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11.
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SDUat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
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PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR RErt
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WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: convert to ESP

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

El Paso converted to ESP. See attached report.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
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May. 03, 2011

Sundry Number: 14724 API Well Number: 43013311180000

EL PASO PRODUCTION Page 1 of 2

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: l'OTTER 2-24B5
Common Well Name: l'OTTER 2-24B5 Spud Date: 8/5/1985
Event Name: I Start: 4/20/2011 End:
Contractor Name: PEAK Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: l'EAK Rig Number: 1100

Date From - To Hours Code Pltase Description of Operations

4/22/2011 07:00 -07:30 0.50 C 18 HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON RIGGING UP. FILLOUT & REVIEW JSA
07:30 -08:30 1.00 C 01 RU RIG
08:30 -11:00 2.50 C 08 PUMP 60 BBLS 2% KCLWTR DOWN CSG WHILE ATTEMPTING TO

BLEED PRESSURE OFF TBG. UNABLETO BLEED OFF TBG. THERE
APPEARS TO BE A SHALLOW TBG LEAK,AS CSG PRESSURE &
TBG PRESSURE WOULD EQUALIZE. BLEED PRESSURE OFF OF
TBG & CSG

11:00 -17:00 6.00 C 04 TOOH LAYlNGDOWN 124 1" RODS (TOP 15 BADLYWORN), 112 7/8"
RODS, 104 3/4" RODS, 24 1" RODS & 2-1/2" X 1-3/4" ROD PUMP

17:00 - 17:30 0.50 C 10 ND WELLHEAD
17:30 -19:00 1.50 C 15 NU BOP STACK& SPOOL. RU WORK FLOOR. RELEASE TAC &

PREP TO PULL TBG.SHUT DOWN FOR EASTER WEEKEND

PUMPED 260 BBLS 2% KCLWTR TODAY

USED 96 GALLONS DIESEL

USED 225 GALLONS PROPANE
4/23/2011 06:00 -06:00 NO ACTIVITYTODAY. SHUT DOWN FOR EASTER WEEKEND
4/24/2011 06:00 -06:00 NO ACTIVITYTODAY. SHUT DOWN FOR EASTER WEEKEND
4/25/2011 06:00 -06:00 NO ACTIVITYTODAY. SHUT DOWN FOR EASTER WEEKEND
4/26/2011 07:00 -07:30 0.50 C 18 HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON PINCH POINTS. FILLOUT & REVIEW

JSA
07:30 - 13:30 6.00 C 04 TOOH WI 23 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG, X-OVER, 270 JTS 2-7/8"DSS TBG,

X-OVER, 1 JT 2-7/8"EUE TBG, TAC, 7 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG, SEAT
NIPPLE, PBGA, 2 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG, NO/GO & SOLID PLUG,
LAYlNGDOWN 1 JT TBG Wl4' SPLIT & 38 JTS WI SEVERE ROD
WEAR,

13:30 - 14:15 0.75 C 11 RU DELSCO SLICKLINE UNIT & CHECK TD. TAGGED FILL@ 10312'.
RD SLICKLINE UNIT

14:15 -18:30 4.25 C 04 RIH WI SOLID PLUG, 8 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG, DESANDER, PKR, ON
OFF TOOL, SEAT NIPPLE & 116 JTS 2-7/8" TBG, HYDROTESTING
ALLTBG ABOVE SEAT NIPPLE TO 8500 PSI. SDFN

PUMPED 230 BBLS KCLWTR TODAY

USED 92 GALLONS DIESEL TODAY
USED 200 GALLONS PROPANE TODAY

4/27/2011 07:00 -07:30 0.50 C 18 HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON HYDROTESTING. FILLOUT N&
REVIEW JSA

07:30 -13:00 5.50 C 04 CONTINUE HYDROTESTING TBG IN HOLE Wl128 JTS 2-7/8"TBG
FROM DERRICK& 59 JTS FROM TRAILER TESTING TO 8500 PSI.RD
HYDROTEST UNIT. SET PKR @9295'.

13:00 -14:00 1.00 C 09 FILLANNULUS Wl26 BBLS 2% KCLWTR. PRESSURE TEST CSG
TO 1000 PSI FOR 5 MINUTES. TESTED GOOD

14:00 -16:30 2.50 C 04 RELEASE ONIOFF TOOL. TOOH W/ 303 JTS 2-7/8" TBG, SEAT
NIPPLE & ONIOFF TOOL. SDFN

PUMPED 26 BBLS 2% KCLWTR TODAY

USED 76 GALLONS DIESEL TODAY
4/28/2011 09:00 -09:30 0.50 C 18 HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON SUSPENDED LOADS. FILLOUT &

REVIEW JSA

Printed: 5/2/2011 11:23:32 AM
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TO 1000 PSI FOR 5 MINUTES. TESTED GOOD

14:00 -16:30 2.50 C 04 RELEASE ONIOFF TOOL. TOOH W/ 303 JTS 2-7/8" TBG, SEAT
NIPPLE & ONIOFF TOOL. SDFN

PUMPED 26 BBLS 2% KCLWTR TODAY

USED 76 GALLONS DIESEL TODAY
4/28/2011 09:00 -09:30 0.50 C 18 HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON SUSPENDED LOADS. FILLOUT &

REVIEW JSA

Printed: 5/2/2011 11:23:32 AM

RE CE IVE



May. 03, 2011

Sundry Number: 14724 API Well Number: 43013311180000

EL PASO PRODUCTION Page 2 of 2

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: POTTER 2-24B5
Common Well Name: POTTER 2-24B5 Spud Date: 8/5/1985
Event Name: RECOMPLETION Start: 4/20/2011 End:
Contractor Name: PEAK Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: PEAK Rig Number: 1100

SubDate From - To Hours Code Code Phase Description of Operations

4/28/2011 09:30-12:00 2.50 C 15 ND BOP STACK& SPOOL. NU ESP HANGER SPOOL & BOP STACK.
12:00-13:30 1.50 C 18 MOVE ESP PUMP EQUIPMENT TO WELLHEAD. PREP TO RIH WI

ESP PUMP.

USED 32 GALLONS DIESEL TODAY
4/29/2011 07:00 -07:30 0.50 C 18 HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON RIGGING UP SPOOLERS. FILLOUT &

REVIEW JSA
07:30 -10:30 3.00 C 18 RU SPOOLERS.PU & SERVICE ESP PUMP ASSEMBLY.
10:30 - 16:00 5.50 C 04 TIH WI ESP PUMP ASSEMBLY, 2-7/8"EUE PUP JT, 1 JT 2-7/8"EUE

TBG, SEAT NIPPLE, 1 JT 2-7/8"EUE TBG, DRAIN SUB, 2 JTS
2-7/8"EUE TBG, X-OVER, 228 JTS 2-7/8"DSS TBG, X-OVER, & 67 JTS
2-7/8"EUE TBG

16:00 -17:00 1.00 C 18 SPLICE PENNETRATER LEAD.
17:00 -18:00 1.00 C 15 LANDTBG. ND BOP STACK
18:00 -18:30 0.50 C 10 NU WELL HEAD. SDFN

USED 92 GALLONS DIESEL TODAY

EQUIPMENT FROM YARD
55JTS NEW2-7/8"EUE TBG FROM YARD

EQUIPMENT SENT TO YARD
42 JTS 2-7/8"DSS TBG
9 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG
4-1/2" PBGA
SOLID PLUG
NO/GO
3K B FLANGE
ROD STRING LEFT ON LOCATION

Printed: 5/2/2011 11:23:32 AM

RE CE IVE
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RE CE IVE



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 POTTER 2-24B5 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43013311180000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2124 FSL 0922 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.0S Range: 05.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

4/22/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: convert to ESP

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 El Paso intends to convert to ESP.  

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Marie Okeefe 303 291-6417

TITLE
 Sr Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 5/3/2011

05/09/2011

May. 03, 2011

Sundry Number: 14723 API Well Number: 43013311180000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well POTTER 2-24B5

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP 43013311180000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 E×t ALTAMONT

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

2124 FSL 0922 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.05 Range: 05.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

4/22/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: convert to ESP

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

El Paso intendsto convertto ESP.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Marie Okeefe 303 291-6417 Sr Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/3/2011

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
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bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
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2124 FSL 0922 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.05 Range: 05.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

4/22/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: convert to ESP

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

El Paso intendsto convertto ESP.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Marie Okeefe 303 291-6417 Sr Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/3/2011



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2012

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N3065- El Paso E&P Company, L.P. N3850- EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX. 77002 Houston, TX. 77002

Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038 Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038

CA No. Unit: N/A

LL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/25/2012
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/25/2012
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/27/2012
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 2114377-0181
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Yes
Sb. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: N/A
Sc. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 6/25/2012
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM N/A BIA Not Received
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: N/A
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: Second Oper Chg
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/29/2012
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/29/2012
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/29/:2012
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: N/A
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JUO705
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 6/29/2012
COMMENTS:
Disposal and Injections wells willbe moved when UIC 5 is received.

El Paso.xis

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2012

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N3065- El Paso E&P Company, L.P. N3850- EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX. 77002 Houston, TX. 77002

Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038 Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038

CA No. Unit: N/A

LL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/25/2012
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/25/2012
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/27/2012
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 2114377-0181
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Yes
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8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: Second Oper Chg
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/29/2012
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/29/2012
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/29/:2012
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: N/A
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JUO705
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 6/29/2012
COMMENTS:
Disposal and Injections wells willbe moved when UIC 5 is received.

El Paso.xis



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

Multiple Leases
6 IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do notuse thisform for proposals to drillnewwells,significantlydeepen existingwells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, orto
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER See Attached

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

El Paso E&P Company, L.P. Attn: Maria Gomez
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1001 Louisiana ciTY Houston STATE TX ZIP 77002 (713) 997-5038 See Attached
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See Attached COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

« CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACl( WATER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOr10inalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUC1NG FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Change of
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Name/Operator

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please be advised that El Paso E&P Company, L.P. (current Operator) has changed names to EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
(new Operator) effective June 1, 2012 and that EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is considered the new operator of the attached
well locations.

EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is responsible under the termsand conditionsof the lease(s) for the operations conducted
upon leased lands. Bond coverage is provided by the State of Utah Statewide Blanket Bond No. 400JUO705, Bureau of Land
Management Nationwide Bond No. 103601420, and Bureau of Indian Affairs Nationwide Bond No. 103601473.

Frank W. Fallerr Frank W. Falleri
Vice President Sr. Vice President
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.

NAME(PLEAS NT) Maria S. Gomez TITLE Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE

E

DATE 6/22/2012

(ThisspaceforStateuseonly) RECEIVED
D JUN2 5 2012

. . . _ gee instrucuans on Reverse sd•) Olv.0F OIL,GAS&MINING"°°bivision of Oil,Gasand Mining-
Earlenekussell, Engineering Techniclaa

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
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DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

Multiple Leases
6 IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do notuse thisform for proposals to drillnewwells,significantlydeepen existingwells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, orto
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER See Attached

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

El Paso E&P Company, L.P. Attn: Maria Gomez
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
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QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
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« CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACl( WATER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOr10inalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUC1NG FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Change of
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12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please be advised that El Paso E&P Company, L.P. (current Operator) has changed names to EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
(new Operator) effective June 1, 2012 and that EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is considered the new operator of the attached
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upon leased lands. Bond coverage is provided by the State of Utah Statewide Blanket Bond No. 400JUO705, Bureau of Land
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Frank W. Fallerr Frank W. Falleri
Vice President Sr. Vice President
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.

NAME(PLEAS NT) Maria S. Gomez TITLE Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE

E

DATE 6/22/2012

(ThisspaceforStateuseonly) RECEIVED
D JUN2 5 2012

. . . _ gee instrucuans on Reverse sd•) Olv.0F OIL,GAS&MINING"°°bivision of Oil,Gasand Mining-
Earlenekussell, Engineering Techniclaa



El Paso E1 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E1 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

Well Well
Well Name Sec TWP RNG API Number Entity Lease Type Type Status Conf
DVVR3-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301350070 14204621118 OVV APD C
LAKEWOOD ESTATES 3-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301350127 1420H621328 OW APD C
YOUNG3-15A3 15 010S 030W 4301350122 FEE OW APD C
WHITING4-1A2 01 010S 020W 4301350424 Fee OW APD C
ELFUMSO4-34A4 34 010S 040VV 4301350720 Fee OVV APD C
YOUNG 2-281 02 020S 010W 4304751180 FEE OW APD C
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-1084 10 020S 040W 4301350712 18221 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-2684 26 020S 040W 4301350714 18432 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-24B4 24 020S 040W 4301350717 18315 Fee OW DRL C
Cook4-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301351162 18449 Fee OVV DRL C
Peterson4-22C6 22 030S 060VV 4301351163 18518 Fee OVV DRL C
LakeForkRanch4-14B4 14 020S 040VV 4301351240 99999 Fee 04V DRL C
Ahelesco4-20C6 20 030S 060VV 4301351241 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Peck3-13BS 13 020S 050VV 4301351364 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Jensen2-9C4 09 030S 040VV 4301351375 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
El Paso 3-5C4 05 030S 040W 4301351376 18563 Fee OW DRL C
ULT6-31 31 030S 020E 4304740033 FEE O\¾ LA
OBERHANSLY 2-2A1 02 010S 010W 4304740164 FEE OW LA
DWR 3-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301351433 14-20-H62-4724 OW NEW C
LakeForkRanch5-23B4 23 0208 040VV 4301360739 Fee CNV NEVV
DuchesneLand4-10C5 10 030S 050VV 4301351262 Fee OVV NEVV C
Cabinland 4-9B3 09 020S 030W 4301351374 Fee OW NEW C
Layton 4-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301351389 Fee OW NEW C
Golinski4-24BS 24 020S 050VV 4301351404 Fee OiN NE\N C
AII>a1-21C4 21 030S 040VV 4301351460 Fee 04V NEVV C
Allison4-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301351466 Fee ONV NEVV C
Seeley 4-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301351486 Fee OW NEW C
Allen4-25B5 25 020S 050VV 4301351487 Fee OVV NEVV C
Hewett 2-6C4 06 030S 040W 4301351489 Fee OW NEW C
Young2-7C4 07 030S 040VV 4301351500 Fee OVV NEVV C
Brighton 3-31A1E 31 010S 010E 4304752471 Fee OW NEW C
Hamaker3-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304752491 Fee OVV NEVV C
Bolton3-29A1E 29 010S 010E 4304752871 Fee OVV NEVV C
HORROCKS5-20A1 20 010S 010W 4301334280 17378 FEE OW OPS C
DWR 3-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301334263 17440 14-20-462-1120 OW P
DWR 3-22C6 22 030S 060W 4301334106 17298 14-20-462-1131 OW P
DWR 3-28C6 28 030S 060W 4301334264 17360 14-20-462-1323 OW P
UTE 1-7A2 07 010S 020W 4301330025 5850 14-20-462-811 OW
UTE2-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301331033 10115 14-20-H62-1118 OiN P
WLRTRIBAL2-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301331035 10250 14-20-H62-1120 OW P
CEDAR RIM 10-A-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330615 6420 14-20-H62-1128 OW P
CEDAR RIM 12A B 030S 060W 4301331173 10672 14-20-H62-1323 OW P
UTE-FEE 2-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301331123 10365 14-20-H62-1328 OW P
TAYLOR3-34C6 34 030S 060VV 4301350200 17572 1420H621329 CNV P
BAKER UTE 2-34C6 34 030S 060W 4301332634 14590 14-20-H62-1329 OW P
UTE 3-35Z2 K 35 010N 020W 4301331133 10483 14-20-H62-1614 OW P
UTE 1-32Z2 32 010N 020W 4301330379 1915 14-20-H62-1702 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-33D 33 010N 020W 4301330334 1851 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTE 2-33Z2 33 010N 020W 4301331111 10451 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTETRIBAL2-34Z2 010N 020W 4301331167 10668 14-20-H62-1704 OW
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-13B4 13 020S 040W 4301334262 17439 14-20-H62-1743 OW P
Üii 1-28B4 28 020S 040VV 4301330242 1796 14-20-H62-1745 OVV P
UTE 1-34A4 34 010S 040W 4301330076 1585 14-20-H62-1774 OW P
UTE 1-36A4 36 010S 040VV 4301330069 1580 14-20-H62-1793 (MN P
UTE 1-1B4 01 020S 040W 4301330129 1700 14-20-H62-1798 OW P
UTE 1-31A2 31 010S 020VV 4301330401 1925 14-20-H62-1801 (MN P |

El Paso E1 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E1 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

Well Well
Well Name Sec TWP RNG API Number Entity Lease Type Type Status Conf
DVVR3-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301350070 14204621118 OVV APD C
LAKEWOOD ESTATES 3-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301350127 1420H621328 OW APD C
YOUNG3-15A3 15 010S 030W 4301350122 FEE OW APD C
WHITING4-1A2 01 010S 020W 4301350424 Fee OW APD C
ELFUMSO4-34A4 34 010S 040VV 4301350720 Fee OVV APD C
YOUNG 2-281 02 020S 010W 4304751180 FEE OW APD C
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-1084 10 020S 040W 4301350712 18221 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-2684 26 020S 040W 4301350714 18432 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-24B4 24 020S 040W 4301350717 18315 Fee OW DRL C
Cook4-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301351162 18449 Fee OVV DRL C
Peterson4-22C6 22 030S 060VV 4301351163 18518 Fee OVV DRL C
LakeForkRanch4-14B4 14 020S 040VV 4301351240 99999 Fee 04V DRL C
Ahelesco4-20C6 20 030S 060VV 4301351241 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Peck3-13BS 13 020S 050VV 4301351364 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Jensen2-9C4 09 030S 040VV 4301351375 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
El Paso 3-5C4 05 030S 040W 4301351376 18563 Fee OW DRL C
ULT6-31 31 030S 020E 4304740033 FEE O\¾ LA
OBERHANSLY 2-2A1 02 010S 010W 4304740164 FEE OW LA
DWR 3-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301351433 14-20-H62-4724 OW NEW C
LakeForkRanch5-23B4 23 0208 040VV 4301360739 Fee CNV NEVV
DuchesneLand4-10C5 10 030S 050VV 4301351262 Fee OVV NEVV C
Cabinland 4-9B3 09 020S 030W 4301351374 Fee OW NEW C
Layton 4-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301351389 Fee OW NEW C
Golinski4-24BS 24 020S 050VV 4301351404 Fee OiN NE\N C
AII>a1-21C4 21 030S 040VV 4301351460 Fee 04V NEVV C
Allison4-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301351466 Fee ONV NEVV C
Seeley 4-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301351486 Fee OW NEW C
Allen4-25B5 25 020S 050VV 4301351487 Fee OVV NEVV C
Hewett 2-6C4 06 030S 040W 4301351489 Fee OW NEW C
Young2-7C4 07 030S 040VV 4301351500 Fee OVV NEVV C
Brighton 3-31A1E 31 010S 010E 4304752471 Fee OW NEW C
Hamaker3-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304752491 Fee OVV NEVV C
Bolton3-29A1E 29 010S 010E 4304752871 Fee OVV NEVV C
HORROCKS5-20A1 20 010S 010W 4301334280 17378 FEE OW OPS C
DWR 3-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301334263 17440 14-20-462-1120 OW P
DWR 3-22C6 22 030S 060W 4301334106 17298 14-20-462-1131 OW P
DWR 3-28C6 28 030S 060W 4301334264 17360 14-20-462-1323 OW P
UTE 1-7A2 07 010S 020W 4301330025 5850 14-20-462-811 OW
UTE2-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301331033 10115 14-20-H62-1118 OiN P
WLRTRIBAL2-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301331035 10250 14-20-H62-1120 OW P
CEDAR RIM 10-A-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330615 6420 14-20-H62-1128 OW P
CEDAR RIM 12A B 030S 060W 4301331173 10672 14-20-H62-1323 OW P
UTE-FEE 2-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301331123 10365 14-20-H62-1328 OW P
TAYLOR3-34C6 34 030S 060VV 4301350200 17572 1420H621329 CNV P
BAKER UTE 2-34C6 34 030S 060W 4301332634 14590 14-20-H62-1329 OW P
UTE 3-35Z2 K 35 010N 020W 4301331133 10483 14-20-H62-1614 OW P
UTE 1-32Z2 32 010N 020W 4301330379 1915 14-20-H62-1702 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-33D 33 010N 020W 4301330334 1851 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTE 2-33Z2 33 010N 020W 4301331111 10451 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTETRIBAL2-34Z2 010N 020W 4301331167 10668 14-20-H62-1704 OW
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-13B4 13 020S 040W 4301334262 17439 14-20-H62-1743 OW P
Üii 1-28B4 28 020S 040VV 4301330242 1796 14-20-H62-1745 OVV P
UTE 1-34A4 34 010S 040W 4301330076 1585 14-20-H62-1774 OW P
UTE 1-36A4 36 010S 040VV 4301330069 1580 14-20-H62-1793 (MN P
UTE 1-1B4 01 020S 040W 4301330129 1700 14-20-H62-1798 OW P
UTE 1-31A2 31 010S 020VV 4301330401 1925 14-20-H62-1801 (MN P |



El Paso E2 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E2 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE1-25A3 25 010S 030VV4301330370 1920 'Wi-20-H62-1802 OVV P
UTE 2-25A3 25 010S 030W 4301331343 11361 14-20-H62-1802 OW P
UTE 1-26A3 26 OS 030W 4301330348 1890 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTE 2-26A3 26 010S 030W 4301331340 11349 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTETRIBAL4-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301350274 18009 1420H621804 OVV P C
UTE 2-35A3 35 010S 030W 4301331292 11222 14-20-H62-1804 ÖW P
UTE3-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301331365 11454 14-20-H62-1804 OIVV P
UTE 145B2 06 0208: 020VV4301330349 1895 14-20-H62-1807 O\N P
UTE 2-6B2 06 020S 020W 4301331140 11190 14-20-H62-1807 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-682 06 020S 020W 4301350273 18008 14-20-H62-1807 OW P C
POWELL 4-19A1 19 010S 010W 4301330071 8302 14-20-H62-1847 OW P
COLTHARP 1-27Z1 27 010N 010W 4301330151 4700 14-20-H62-1933 OW P
UTE 1-8A1E 08 010S 010E 4304730173 1846 14-20-H62-2147 OW P
UTETRIBE 1-31 31 010N 020VV 4301330278 4755 14-20-H62-2.421 OVV P
UTE 1-28B6X 28 020S 060W 4301330510 11165 14-20-H62-2492 OW P
RINKER 2-21B5 21 020S 050W 4301334166 17299 14-20-H62-2508 OW P
MURDOCK 2-34B5 34 020S 050W 4301331132 10456 14-20-H62-2511 OW P
LffE 1-3586 [35 0206; 060VV4301330507 2335 14-20-H62-2531 O\N P
UTE TRIBAL1-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304730829 860 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE 2-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304737831 16709 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE TRIBAL1-27A1E \27 010S 010E 4304730421 800 14-20-H62-2662 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-35A1E 35 010S 010E 4304730286 795 14-20-H62-2665 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-15A1E 15 010S 010E 4304730820 850 14-20-H62-2717 OW P
UTE TRIBAL P-3B1E 03 02 S 010E 4304730190 4536 14-20-H62-2873 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-22ATE 22 010S 010E 4304730429 810 14-20-H62-3103 OW P
BHUTE1-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301330419 10705 14-20-H62-3436 09/ P
BHUTE2-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301332790 15802 14-20-H62-3436 OV/ P
MCFARLANE 1-4D6 04 040S 060W 4301331074 10325 14-20-H62-3452 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-11D6 11 040S 060W 4301330482 6415 14-20-H62-3454 OW P
CARSON 2-36A1 36 010S 010W 4304731407 737 14-20-H62-3806 OW P
UTE 2-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301330775 9133 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
DWR 3-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301334003 17092 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
THE PERFECT "10" 1-10A1 10 010S 010W 4301330935 9461 14-20-H62-3855 OW
BADGER-SAM HU MONGUS1-15A1 15 010S 010W 4301330949 9462 14-20-H62-3860 OW P
MAXIMILLIAN-UTE14-1 14 010S 030W 4301330726 8437 14-20-H62-3868 OW P
FRED BASSETT 1-22A1 22 010S 010W 4301330781 9460 14-20-H62-3880 OW
UTETRIBAL1-30Z1 30 010N 010VV 4301330813 9405 14-20-H62-3910 OVV P
UTE LB 1-13A3 13 010S 030W 4301330894 9402 14-20-H62-3980 OW P
UTE2-22B6 22 020S 060VV 4301331444 11641 14-20-H62-4614 OVV P
UINTA QURAY 1-1A3 01 010S 030W 4301330132 5540 14-20-H62-4664 OW P
UTE 1-6D6 06 040S 060W 4301331696 12058 14-20-H62-4752 0W
UTE2-11D6 11 040S 060VV 4301350179 17667 1420H624801 OVV P
LÏÑï1-15D6 15 040S 060VV 4301330429 10958 14-20-H62-4824 OVV P
UTE2-15D6 15 040S 060W 4301334026 17193 14-20-H624824 OW
HILL3-24C6 24 030S 060VV 4301350293 18020 1420H624866 OVV P C
BARCLAYUTE 2-24C6R 24 030S 060W 4301333730 16385 14-20-H62-4866 OW P
BROTHERSON 1-2B4 |02 020S 040W 4301330062 1570 FEE OW P
BOREN 1-24A2 24 010S 020W 4301330084 5740 FEE _ 0W
FARNSWORTH 1-13BS 13 020S 050W 4301330092 1610 FEE OW P
BROADHEAD 1-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301330100 1595 FEE OW P
ASAYEJ 1-20A1 20 010S 010VV 4301330102 8304 FEE OVV P
HANSONTRUST 1-5B3 05 020S 030W 4301330109 1635 FEE OW P
ELLSO/ORTH1-8B4 08 020S 040VV 4301330112 1655 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-9B4 09 020S 040VV 4301330118 1660 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-17B4 17 020S 040VV 4301330126 1695 FEE OVV P
CHANDLER1-5B4 05 020S 040VV 4301330140 1685 FEE OVV P
HANSON1-32A3 32 010S 030VV 4301330141 1640 FEE OVV P
JESSEN 1-17A4 17 010S 040VV 4301330173 4725 FEE OVV P

El Paso E2 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E2 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE1-25A3 25 010S 030VV4301330370 1920 'Wi-20-H62-1802 OVV P
UTE 2-25A3 25 010S 030W 4301331343 11361 14-20-H62-1802 OW P
UTE 1-26A3 26 OS 030W 4301330348 1890 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTE 2-26A3 26 010S 030W 4301331340 11349 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTETRIBAL4-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301350274 18009 1420H621804 OVV P C
UTE 2-35A3 35 010S 030W 4301331292 11222 14-20-H62-1804 ÖW P
UTE3-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301331365 11454 14-20-H62-1804 OIVV P
UTE 145B2 06 0208: 020VV4301330349 1895 14-20-H62-1807 O\N P
UTE 2-6B2 06 020S 020W 4301331140 11190 14-20-H62-1807 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-682 06 020S 020W 4301350273 18008 14-20-H62-1807 OW P C
POWELL 4-19A1 19 010S 010W 4301330071 8302 14-20-H62-1847 OW P
COLTHARP 1-27Z1 27 010N 010W 4301330151 4700 14-20-H62-1933 OW P
UTE 1-8A1E 08 010S 010E 4304730173 1846 14-20-H62-2147 OW P
UTETRIBE 1-31 31 010N 020VV 4301330278 4755 14-20-H62-2.421 OVV P
UTE 1-28B6X 28 020S 060W 4301330510 11165 14-20-H62-2492 OW P
RINKER 2-21B5 21 020S 050W 4301334166 17299 14-20-H62-2508 OW P
MURDOCK 2-34B5 34 020S 050W 4301331132 10456 14-20-H62-2511 OW P
LffE 1-3586 [35 0206; 060VV4301330507 2335 14-20-H62-2531 O\N P
UTE TRIBAL1-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304730829 860 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE 2-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304737831 16709 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE TRIBAL1-27A1E \27 010S 010E 4304730421 800 14-20-H62-2662 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-35A1E 35 010S 010E 4304730286 795 14-20-H62-2665 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-15A1E 15 010S 010E 4304730820 850 14-20-H62-2717 OW P
UTE TRIBAL P-3B1E 03 02 S 010E 4304730190 4536 14-20-H62-2873 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-22ATE 22 010S 010E 4304730429 810 14-20-H62-3103 OW P
BHUTE1-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301330419 10705 14-20-H62-3436 09/ P
BHUTE2-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301332790 15802 14-20-H62-3436 OV/ P
MCFARLANE 1-4D6 04 040S 060W 4301331074 10325 14-20-H62-3452 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-11D6 11 040S 060W 4301330482 6415 14-20-H62-3454 OW P
CARSON 2-36A1 36 010S 010W 4304731407 737 14-20-H62-3806 OW P
UTE 2-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301330775 9133 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
DWR 3-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301334003 17092 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
THE PERFECT "10" 1-10A1 10 010S 010W 4301330935 9461 14-20-H62-3855 OW
BADGER-SAM HU MONGUS1-15A1 15 010S 010W 4301330949 9462 14-20-H62-3860 OW P
MAXIMILLIAN-UTE14-1 14 010S 030W 4301330726 8437 14-20-H62-3868 OW P
FRED BASSETT 1-22A1 22 010S 010W 4301330781 9460 14-20-H62-3880 OW
UTETRIBAL1-30Z1 30 010N 010VV 4301330813 9405 14-20-H62-3910 OVV P
UTE LB 1-13A3 13 010S 030W 4301330894 9402 14-20-H62-3980 OW P
UTE2-22B6 22 020S 060VV 4301331444 11641 14-20-H62-4614 OVV P
UINTA QURAY 1-1A3 01 010S 030W 4301330132 5540 14-20-H62-4664 OW P
UTE 1-6D6 06 040S 060W 4301331696 12058 14-20-H62-4752 0W
UTE2-11D6 11 040S 060VV 4301350179 17667 1420H624801 OVV P
LÏÑï1-15D6 15 040S 060VV 4301330429 10958 14-20-H62-4824 OVV P
UTE2-15D6 15 040S 060W 4301334026 17193 14-20-H624824 OW
HILL3-24C6 24 030S 060VV 4301350293 18020 1420H624866 OVV P C
BARCLAYUTE 2-24C6R 24 030S 060W 4301333730 16385 14-20-H62-4866 OW P
BROTHERSON 1-2B4 |02 020S 040W 4301330062 1570 FEE OW P
BOREN 1-24A2 24 010S 020W 4301330084 5740 FEE _ 0W
FARNSWORTH 1-13BS 13 020S 050W 4301330092 1610 FEE OW P
BROADHEAD 1-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301330100 1595 FEE OW P
ASAYEJ 1-20A1 20 010S 010VV 4301330102 8304 FEE OVV P
HANSONTRUST 1-5B3 05 020S 030W 4301330109 1635 FEE OW P
ELLSO/ORTH1-8B4 08 020S 040VV 4301330112 1655 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-9B4 09 020S 040VV 4301330118 1660 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-17B4 17 020S 040VV 4301330126 1695 FEE OVV P
CHANDLER1-5B4 05 020S 040VV 4301330140 1685 FEE OVV P
HANSON1-32A3 32 010S 030VV 4301330141 1640 FEE OVV P
JESSEN 1-17A4 17 010S 040VV 4301330173 4725 FEE OVV P



El Paso E3 Company, LP. (N3065) to EP Energy E3 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

JENKINS1-1B3 01 020S 030VV 4301330175 1790 FEE O¾V P
GOODRICH 1-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301330182 1765 FEE OW P
ELLSVVORTH1-19B4 19 020S 040VV 4301330183 1760 FEE ONV P
O(TYLE1-10B3 10 020S 030VV 4301330187 1810 FEE OVV P
JOS. SMITH1-17C5 17 iO30S 050W 4301330188 5510 FEE OW
RUDY 1-11B3 11 020S 030W \43013302041820 FEE OW
CROCu(1-BB4 06 020S 040VV 4301330213 1825 FEE OVV P
HUNT1-21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301330214 1840 FEE OVV P
LAVVRENCE1-30B4 30 020S 040VV 4301330220 1845 FEE ONV P
YOUNK31-29B4 29 020S 040VV 4301330246 1791 FEE 04V P
GRIFFITHS1-33B4 33 020S 040W 4301330288 4760 FEE OW
PCrrTER1-2B5 02 020S 050VV 4301330293 1826 FEE DVV P
BRCITHERSCR41-26B4 26 020S 040VV 4301330336 1856 FEE ONV P
SADIEMBLANK1-33Z1 33 010N 010VV 4301330355 765 FEE OVV P
PCFEFER 1-24B5 24 020S 050VV 4301330356 1730 FEE O\N P
VVHITEHELAD1-22A3 22 010S: 030VV 4301330357 1885 FEE OVV P
CHASELMILLER2-1A2 01 010S 0200/ 4301330360 5830 FEE OWI P
ELDER1-13B2 13 020S 020VV 4301330366 1905 FEE OVV P
BROTHERSON 2-10B4 10 020S 040W 4301330443 1615 FEE OW P
FARNSWORTH 2-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301330470 1935 FEE OW P
TEVV1-15A3 15 010S 030VV 4301330529 1945 FEE OVV P
UTEFEE2-20C5 20 030S 050VV 4301330550 4527 FEE ONV P
FN3USTCad1-34Z1 34 010N 010VV 4301330566 885 FEE OVV P
GALLOVVAY1-18B1 18 020S 010VV 4301330575 2365 FEE OVV P
SMfTH1-31B5 31 020S 050VV 4301330577 1955 FEE OVV P
LEBEAU 1-34A1 34 010S 010W 4301330590 1440 FEE OW P
LINMAR1-19B2 19 020S 020VV 4301330600 9350 FEE O\N P
AflSSE1-28Z1 28 010N 010VV 4301330609 905 FEE ONV P
POVVELL1-21B1 21 020S 010VV 4301330621 910 FEE OVV P
HANSEN 1-24B3 24 020S 030VV 4301330629 2390 FEE OVV P
OhAAN2-4B4 04 020S 040VV 4301330645 9125 FEE OVV P
DYE 1-25Z2 25 010N 020W 4301330659 9111 FEE OW
HMARTIN 1-21Z1 21 010N 010VV 4301330707 925 FEE OVV P
JENSEN 1-29Z1 29 010N 010W 4301330725 9110 FEE OW P
CHASEL2-17A1V 17 010S 010VV 4301330732 9112 FEE OVV P
BIRCHELL 1-27A1 27 010S 010W 4301330758 940 FEE OW P
CHRISTENSEN2-8B3 08 020S 030W 4301330780 9355 FEE OW
LAMICQ2-SB2 05 020S 020W 4301330784 2302 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 2-14B4 14 020S 040W 4301330815 10450 FEE OW P
WRJRRAA'3-2A2 02 010S 020VVl4301330816 9620 FEE OVV P
HORROCKS2-20A1 V 20 010S 010W 4301330833 8301 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON2-2B4 02 020S 040W 4301330855 8420 FEE ÒV\Ï P
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El Paso E6 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E6 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HARVEST FELLOWSHIP CHURCH2-14B1 020S 010W 4304739591 16546 FEE OW P
OBERHANSLY 3-11A1 _ 010S 010W 4304739679 17937 FEE OW
DUNCAN 2-34A1 34 010S 010W 4304739944 17043 FEE OW P
BISEL GURR 4-11A1 11 010S 010W 4304739961 16791 FEE OW
KILLIAN3-12A1 12 010S: 010VV 4304740226 17761 ML39760 O\N P
WAINOCO ST 1-1ÀB 020S 010W 4304730818 1420 ML-24306-A OW
UTAH ST UTE 1-35A1 35 010S 010W 4304730182 5520 ML-25432 OW
ST/VTE 1-19A4 19 0106; 040VV 4301330322 9118 ML-27912 OiN P
FEDERAL 2-28E19E 28 OSOS 190E 4304732849 12117 UTU-0143512 OW
FEDERAL 1-28E19E 28 050S 190E 4304730175 5680 UTU143512 O\¾ P
BLANCHARD 1-3A2 03 010S 020W 4301320316 5877 FEE OW PA
WH BLANCHARD 2-3A2 03 010S 020W 4301330008 5775 FEE OW PA
YACKU 1-7A1 07 010S 010VV 4301330018 5795 FEE OVV PA
JAAAESPOVVELL3 _ 13 010S 020VV 4301330024 8305 FEE VVD PA
BASTIAN1(3-7D) 07 010S 010VV 4301330026 5800 FEE OLV PA
LAMICQ-URRUTY 1-8A2 08 010S 020W 4301330036 5975 FEE OW_ PA
BLEAJJARD1-18B4 18 020S 040VV 4301330059 11262 FEE OVV PA
OLSEN 1-27A4 27 010S 040VV 4301330064 1565 FEE OVV F%4
EVANS 1-31A4 31 010S 040W 4301330067 5330 FEE OW
HAAABLIN1-26A2 26 010S 020VV 4301330083 2305 FEE OUV _F4
HARTMAN 1-31A3 31 010S 030W 4301330093 10700 FEE OW PA
FARNSWORTH1-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301330097 5725 FEE OW A
POVVELL1-33A3 33 010S 030VV 4301330105 4526 FEE OVV 44
LOTRIDGEGATES 1-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301330117 1625 FEE OW
REMINGTON 1-34A3 34 010S 030W 4301330139 1670 FEE OW
ANDERSON 1-28A2 28 010S 020W 4301330150 5895 FEE OW
RHOADESMOON 1-35B5 35 020S 050W 4301330155 5270 FEE OW PA
JC44N 1-3B2 03 020S 020VV 4301330160 5765 FEE O\N
SMITH 14C5 06 030S 050VV 4301330163 5385 FEE OVV F44
HORRCK3KSFEE 1-3A1 03 010S 010VV 4301330171 5505 FEE OVV !¾4
VVARREN1-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301330174 9139 FEE CAV PA
JENSENFENZEL1-20C5 20 030S 050VV 4301330177 4730 FEE ONV PA
MNTilNRANCH1-13B4 13 020S 040VV 4301330180 4524 FEE OVV PA
BFKITHERSON 1-27B4 27 020S 040VV 4301330185 1775 FEE OVV PA
JENSEN 1-31AS 31 010S 050VV 4301330186 4735 FEE OVV 144
ROBERTSON 1-29A2 29 010S 020W 4301330189 4740 FEE OW Ä
VVINKLER1-28A3 28 010S 030VV 4301330191 5465 FEE ONV PA
CHENEY1-33A2 33 010S 020VV 4301330202 1750 FEE O¾V 144
J LAMICQSTATE 1-681 06 020S 010W 4301330210 5730 FEE OW PA
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REEDER1-17B5 17 020S 050VV 4301330218 5460 FEE O\N PA
ROBERTSONUTE 1-2B2 02 020S 020W 4301330225 1710 FEE OW A
HATCH1-5B1 05 020S 010VV 4301330226 5470 FEE OVV PA
BROTHERSON1-22B4 22 020S 040VV 4301330227 5935 FEE OVV PA
ALLRED1-16A3 16 010S 030VV 4301330232 1780 FEE OVV 144
BIRCH1-35A5 35 010S 0509/ 4301330233 9116 FEE OVV 4
MARQUERITEUTE 1-882 08 020S 020W 4301330235 9122 FEE OW A
BU22I1-11B2 11 020S 020VV4301330248 6335 FEE 01N 44
SHISLER 1-3B 03 020S 010VV4301330249 5960 FEE OW A
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\/ODAUTE 1-‡C5 0.4 030S 050VV4301330283 4530 FEE 09V PA
BROTHERSON 1-28A4 010S 040W 4301330292 9114 FEE OW PA
MEAGHER 1-4B2 04 020S 020W 4301330313 8402 FEE OW PA
NORLING 1-9B1 020S 010W 4301330315 1811 FEE OW Ä
S. BROADHEAD 1-9C5 09 030S 050W 4301330316 5940 FEE OW PA
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El Paso E7 Company, LP. (N3065) to EP Energy E7 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012
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STATE1-8A3 08 010S 030W 4301330286 5655 ML-24316 OW A
UTAHFEDERAL1-24B1 24 020S 010W 4304730220 590 ML-26079 OW PA
CEDAR RIM 15 34 030S 060W 4301330383 6395 14-20-462- 29 OW S
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El Paso E8 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E8 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE TRIBAL2-24C7 24 030S 070W 4301331028 10240 14-20-H62-1135 OW S
CEDARRIM12 28 030S 060W 4301330344 6370 14-20-H62-1323 OW IS
CEDARRIM16 33 030S 060W 4301330363 6390 14-20-H62-1328 OW S
SPRING HOLLOW 2-34Z3 34 010N 030W 4301330234 5255 14-20-H62-1480 OW S
E3/ANSUTE1-17B3 17 020S 030VV 4301330274 5335 14-20-H62-1733 OVV S
UTE JENKS 2-1-B4 G 01 020S 040W 4301331197 10844 14-20-H62-1782 OW S
LffE3-12B3 12 020S 030VV 4301331379 11490 14-20-H62-1810 OVV S
UTE TRIBAL9-4B1 04 020S 010W 4301330194 5715 14-20-H62-1969 OW S
UTE TRIBAL 2-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301331424 11615 14-20-H62-2489 OW S
UTE 1-33B6 33 020S 060W 4301330441 1230 14-20-H62-2493 OW S
UTE2-22B5 22 0206; 050VV 4301331122 10453 14-:20-H62-2509 O\N S
UTE1-1881E 18 020S 010E 4304730969 9135 14-20-H62-2864 O\¾ S
LAUREN UTE 1-23A3 23 010S 030W 4301330895 9403 14-20-H62-3981 OW S
UTE 2-28B6 28 020S 060W 4301331434 116i4 14-20-H62-4622 OW S
UTE 1-27B6X 27 020S 060W 4301330517 11166 14-20-H62-4631 OW S
UTE2-27B6 27 020S 060VV 4301331449 11660 14-20-H62-4:331 ONV S
CEDAR RIM10-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330328 6365 14-20-H62-4724 OW 5
UTE 5-30A2 30 010S 020W 4301330169 5910 14-20-H62-4863 OW S
UTE TRIBAL G-1 (1-24C6) 24 030S 060W 4301330298 4533 14-20-H62-4866 OW S
UTE TRIBAL FEDERAL 1-30C5 30 030S 050W 4301330475 665 14-20-H62-4876 OW S
SMB1-10A2 10 010S 020VV 4301330012 5865 FEE OVV S
KENDALL1-12A2 12 010S 020VV 4301330013 5875 FEE ONV S
CEDARRIM2 20 030S 060VV .4301330019 6315 FEE ONV S
URRUTY 2-9A2 09 010S 020W 4301330046 5855 FEE OW S
BROTHERSON 1-14B4

J¯
ÕžÕŠ040W

4301330Ò5
1̄535 FEE OW

RUST1-4B3 04 020S 030VV 4301330063 1575 FEE OVV S
WK3NSEN1-21A3 21 010S 030VV4301330082 1590 FEE O\¾ S
BFKITHERSCRM1-10B4 10 020S 040VV 4301330110 1614 FEE ONV S
FÄRNSWORTH 1-12B5 12 020S 050W 4301330124 1645 FEE OW 5
ELLSVIORTH1-16B4 16 020S 040VV .4301330192 1735 FEE ONV S
MARSHALL1-;K)A3 20 010S 030VV 4301330193 9340 FEE OVV S
CHRISTMAN BLAND 1-31B4 31 020S 040W 4301330198 4745 FEE M S
FK)PER1-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301330217 1850 FEE O\¾ S
EUROTHERSO‡l1-24B4 24 020S 040VV 4301330229 1865 FEE OVV S
BFMITHERSCRM1-33A4 33 010S 040VV 4301330272 1680 FEE ONV S
BROTHERSON 1-23B4 23 020S 040W 4301330483 8423 FEE OW S
SMITHALBERT2-8C5 08 030S 050VV 4301330543 5495 FEE OVV S
VODAJOSEPHINE2-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301330553 5650 FEE ONV S
HANSEN1-16B3 16 020S 030VV 4301330617 9124 FEE OVV S
BFMITHERSCR41-25B4 25 020S 040VV 4301330668 9126 FEE 04V S
POWELL 2-33A3 33 010S 030W 4301330704 2400 FEE OW S
BROWN2-28B5 28 020S 050W 4301330718 9131 FEE OW
EULA-UTE1-16A1 16 010S 010VV 4301330782 8443 FEE O\N S
JESSEN 1-15A4 15 010S 040VV 4301330817 9345 FEE ONV S
REK3USTON 1-22Z1 22 010N 010VV 4301330884 936 FEE 04V S
FIELDSTED 2-27A4 27 010S 040W 4301330915 9632 FEE OW S
HANSKUTT 2-23B5 _ 23 020S 050W 4301330917 9600 FEE OW S
TIMOTHY 4-18A3 18 010S 030W 4301330940 9633 FEE OW S
BFKITHERSON2-3B4 03 020S 040VV 4301331008 10165 FEE ONV S
BROTHERSON 2-22B4 22 020S 1040W 4301331086 1782 FEE OW S
MILES2-35A4 35 010S 040W 4301331087 1966 FEE OW S
ELLSWORTH 2-17B4 17 020S 040W 4301331089 1696 FEE OW
RUST 2-36A4 36 010S 040W 4301331092 1577 FEE OW S
E\h4NS2-19B3 19 020S 030VV 4301331113 1777 FEE OiN iS
FARNSWORTH 2-12BS 12 020S 050W 4301331115 1646 FEE OW S
CHRISTENSEN 3-4B4 04 020S 040W 4301331142 10481 FEE OW Š
ROBERTSON 2-29A2 29 010S 020W ¡430133115010679 , FEE OW S
CEDAR RIM2A näiÏW 4301331172 10671 E OW S

El Paso E8 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E8 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE TRIBAL2-24C7 24 030S 070W 4301331028 10240 14-20-H62-1135 OW S
CEDARRIM12 28 030S 060W 4301330344 6370 14-20-H62-1323 OW IS
CEDARRIM16 33 030S 060W 4301330363 6390 14-20-H62-1328 OW S
SPRING HOLLOW 2-34Z3 34 010N 030W 4301330234 5255 14-20-H62-1480 OW S
E3/ANSUTE1-17B3 17 020S 030VV 4301330274 5335 14-20-H62-1733 OVV S
UTE JENKS 2-1-B4 G 01 020S 040W 4301331197 10844 14-20-H62-1782 OW S
LffE3-12B3 12 020S 030VV 4301331379 11490 14-20-H62-1810 OVV S
UTE TRIBAL9-4B1 04 020S 010W 4301330194 5715 14-20-H62-1969 OW S
UTE TRIBAL 2-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301331424 11615 14-20-H62-2489 OW S
UTE 1-33B6 33 020S 060W 4301330441 1230 14-20-H62-2493 OW S
UTE2-22B5 22 0206; 050VV 4301331122 10453 14-:20-H62-2509 O\N S
UTE1-1881E 18 020S 010E 4304730969 9135 14-20-H62-2864 O\¾ S
LAUREN UTE 1-23A3 23 010S 030W 4301330895 9403 14-20-H62-3981 OW S
UTE 2-28B6 28 020S 060W 4301331434 116i4 14-20-H62-4622 OW S
UTE 1-27B6X 27 020S 060W 4301330517 11166 14-20-H62-4631 OW S
UTE2-27B6 27 020S 060VV 4301331449 11660 14-20-H62-4:331 ONV S
CEDAR RIM10-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330328 6365 14-20-H62-4724 OW 5
UTE 5-30A2 30 010S 020W 4301330169 5910 14-20-H62-4863 OW S
UTE TRIBAL G-1 (1-24C6) 24 030S 060W 4301330298 4533 14-20-H62-4866 OW S
UTE TRIBAL FEDERAL 1-30C5 30 030S 050W 4301330475 665 14-20-H62-4876 OW S
SMB1-10A2 10 010S 020VV 4301330012 5865 FEE OVV S
KENDALL1-12A2 12 010S 020VV 4301330013 5875 FEE ONV S
CEDARRIM2 20 030S 060VV .4301330019 6315 FEE ONV S
URRUTY 2-9A2 09 010S 020W 4301330046 5855 FEE OW S
BROTHERSON 1-14B4

J¯
ÕžÕŠ040W

4301330Ò5
1̄535 FEE OW

RUST1-4B3 04 020S 030VV 4301330063 1575 FEE OVV S
WK3NSEN1-21A3 21 010S 030VV4301330082 1590 FEE O\¾ S
BFKITHERSCRM1-10B4 10 020S 040VV 4301330110 1614 FEE ONV S
FÄRNSWORTH 1-12B5 12 020S 050W 4301330124 1645 FEE OW 5
ELLSVIORTH1-16B4 16 020S 040VV .4301330192 1735 FEE ONV S
MARSHALL1-;K)A3 20 010S 030VV 4301330193 9340 FEE OVV S
CHRISTMAN BLAND 1-31B4 31 020S 040W 4301330198 4745 FEE M S
FK)PER1-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301330217 1850 FEE O\¾ S
EUROTHERSO‡l1-24B4 24 020S 040VV 4301330229 1865 FEE OVV S
BFMITHERSCRM1-33A4 33 010S 040VV 4301330272 1680 FEE ONV S
BROTHERSON 1-23B4 23 020S 040W 4301330483 8423 FEE OW S
SMITHALBERT2-8C5 08 030S 050VV 4301330543 5495 FEE OVV S
VODAJOSEPHINE2-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301330553 5650 FEE ONV S
HANSEN1-16B3 16 020S 030VV 4301330617 9124 FEE OVV S
BFMITHERSCR41-25B4 25 020S 040VV 4301330668 9126 FEE 04V S
POWELL 2-33A3 33 010S 030W 4301330704 2400 FEE OW S
BROWN2-28B5 28 020S 050W 4301330718 9131 FEE OW
EULA-UTE1-16A1 16 010S 010VV 4301330782 8443 FEE O\N S
JESSEN 1-15A4 15 010S 040VV 4301330817 9345 FEE ONV S
REK3USTON 1-22Z1 22 010N 010VV 4301330884 936 FEE 04V S
FIELDSTED 2-27A4 27 010S 040W 4301330915 9632 FEE OW S
HANSKUTT 2-23B5 _ 23 020S 050W 4301330917 9600 FEE OW S
TIMOTHY 4-18A3 18 010S 030W 4301330940 9633 FEE OW S
BFKITHERSON2-3B4 03 020S 040VV 4301331008 10165 FEE ONV S
BROTHERSON 2-22B4 22 020S 1040W 4301331086 1782 FEE OW S
MILES2-35A4 35 010S 040W 4301331087 1966 FEE OW S
ELLSWORTH 2-17B4 17 020S 040W 4301331089 1696 FEE OW
RUST 2-36A4 36 010S 040W 4301331092 1577 FEE OW S
E\h4NS2-19B3 19 020S 030VV 4301331113 1777 FEE OiN iS
FARNSWORTH 2-12BS 12 020S 050W 4301331115 1646 FEE OW S
CHRISTENSEN 3-4B4 04 020S 040W 4301331142 10481 FEE OW Š
ROBERTSON 2-29A2 29 010S 020W ¡430133115010679 , FEE OW S
CEDAR RIM2A näiÏW 4301331172 10671 E OW S



El Paso E9 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E9 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

HARTMAN 2-31A3 31 010S 030W 4301331243 11026 FEE OW S
GOODRICH 2-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301331246 11037 FEE OW 'S
JESSEN2-:21A4 21 0106; 040VV 4301331256 11061 FEE C\N S
BROTHERSON3-23B4 23 020S 040W 4301331289 11141 FEE OW S
MYRIN FDANCH2-18B3 18 020S 030VV 4301331297 11475 FEE CAN S
BROTHERSON2-2B5 02 020S 050W 4301331302 11342 FEE OW S
DASTRUP2-30A3 30 010S 030VV 4301331320 11253 FEE 04V S
YOUNK32-30B4 30 020S 040VV 4301331366 11453 FEE ONV S
lOFK32-10B3 10 020S 030VV 4301331388 11482 FEE OVV S
WK3NSEN3-27A3 27 010S 030VV 4301331401 11686 FEE O\¾ S
HORROC‡092-5B1E 05 020S 010E 4304732409 11481 FEE CAN S
I-4RSEN1-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304730552 815 FEE OVV TA
DRYGULCH1-36A1 36 010S 0100/ 4304730569 820 FEE ONV TA

El Paso E9 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E9 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

HARTMAN 2-31A3 31 010S 030W 4301331243 11026 FEE OW S
GOODRICH 2-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301331246 11037 FEE OW 'S
JESSEN2-:21A4 21 0106; 040VV 4301331256 11061 FEE C\N S
BROTHERSON3-23B4 23 020S 040W 4301331289 11141 FEE OW S
MYRIN FDANCH2-18B3 18 020S 030VV 4301331297 11475 FEE CAN S
BROTHERSON2-2B5 02 020S 050W 4301331302 11342 FEE OW S
DASTRUP2-30A3 30 010S 030VV 4301331320 11253 FEE 04V S
YOUNK32-30B4 30 020S 040VV 4301331366 11453 FEE ONV S
lOFK32-10B3 10 020S 030VV 4301331388 11482 FEE OVV S
WK3NSEN3-27A3 27 010S 030VV 4301331401 11686 FEE O\¾ S
HORROC‡092-5B1E 05 020S 010E 4304732409 11481 FEE CAN S
I-4RSEN1-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304730552 815 FEE OVV TA
DRYGULCH1-36A1 36 010S 0100/ 4304730569 820 FEE ONV TA



RECEIVED: Jan. 11, 2013

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 POTTER 2-24B5 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43013311180000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2124 FSL 0922 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.0S Range: 05.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

1 /11 /2013

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  Pump Change

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Please see attached procedure.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038

TITLE
 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 1 /11 /2013

January 31, 2013

Sundry Number: 33775 API Well Number: 43013311180000Sundry Number: 33775 API Well Number: 43013311180000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well POTTER 2-24B5

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY,L.P. 43013311180000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

2124 FSL 0922 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.0S Range: 05.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

/ ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

1/11/2013
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENTREPORT DEEPEN FRACTURETREAT NEWCONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Pump Change

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached procedure. Approved by the
Utah Division of

OFI, Gas and Mining

Date: January 31, 2013

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 1/11/2013

RECEIVED: Jan. 11,

Sundry Number: 33775 API Well Number: 43013311180000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well POTTER 2-24B5

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY,L.P. 43013311180000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

2124 FSL 0922 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.0S Range: 05.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

/ ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

1/11/2013
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENTREPORT DEEPEN FRACTURETREAT NEWCONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Pump Change

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached procedure. Approved by the
Utah Division of

OFI, Gas and Mining

Date: January 31, 2013

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 1/11/2013

RECEIVED: Jan. 11,



RECEIVED: Jan. 11, 2013

Potter 2-24B5 Procedure Summary 

• POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing 

• Acidize existing perfs w/ 5,000 gal 15% HCl. 

• RIH w/ BHA, tubing and rod string 

• Clean location and resume production 

Sundry Number: 33775 API Well Number: 43013311180000Sundry Number: 33775 API Well Number: 43013311180000

Potter 2-24B5 Procedure Summary
• POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing
• Acidize existing perfs w/ 5,000 gal 15% HCI.
• RIH w/ BHA, tubing and rod string
• Clean location and resume production

RECEIVED: Jan. 11,

Sundry Number: 33775 API Well Number: 43013311180000

Potter 2-24B5 Procedure Summary

• POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing
• Acidize existing perfs w/ 5,000 gal 15% HCI.
• RIH w/ BHA, tubing and rod string
• Clean location and resume production

RECEIVED: Jan. 11,



RECEIVED: Jun. 05, 2014

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 POTTER 2-24B5 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43013311180000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2124 FSL 0922 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.0S Range: 05.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

6 /9 /2014

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  see below

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 • POOH w/ tubing & rods • Swab perfs from 9,326' - 9,715' and from
9,910' - 10,202' • Squeeze perfs based on oil cut from swab test, most
likely scenario: squeeze perfs from 9,326' - 9,715' w/ 360 sx Class “G”

• Drill out cement • RIH w/BHA, tubing, pump, and rods • Resume
production from perfs at 9,910' - 10,202' • Clean location 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038

TITLE
 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 6 /5 /2014

June 17, 2014

Sundry Number: 51989 API Well Number: 43013311180000Sundry Number: 51989 API Well Number: 43013311180000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well POTTER 2-24B5

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY,L.P. 43013311180000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

2124 FSL 0922 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.0S Range: 05.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

6/9/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: see below

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
• POOH w/ tubing & rods • Swab perfs from 9,326' - 9,715' and from Approved by the

9,910' - 10,202' • Squeeze perfs based on oil cut from swab test, most utah Division of
likely scenario: squeeze perfs from 9,326' - 9,715' w/ 360 sx Class "G" Gae 1anci ning

• Drill out cement • RIH w/BHA, tubing, pump, and rods • Resume Date:
production from perfs at 9,910' - 10,202' • Clean location

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 6/5/2014

RECEIVED: Jun. 05,

Sundry Number: 51989 API Well Number: 43013311180000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well POTTER 2-24B5

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY,L.P. 43013311180000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

2124 FSL 0922 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.0S Range: 05.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

6/9/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: see below

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
• POOH w/ tubing & rods • Swab perfs from 9,326' - 9,715' and from Approved by the

9,910' - 10,202' • Squeeze perfs based on oil cut from swab test, most utah Division of
likely scenario: squeeze perfs from 9,326' - 9,715' w/ 360 sx Class "G" Gae 1anci ning

• Drill out cement • RIH w/BHA, tubing, pump, and rods • Resume Date:
production from perfs at 9,910' - 10,202' • Clean location

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 6/5/2014

RECEIVED: Jun. 05,



RECEIVED: Jul. 03, 2014

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 POTTER 2-24B5 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43013311180000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2124 FSL 0922 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.0S Range: 05.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

6 /26 /2014

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  See below

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Swabbed perfs from 9326'-9715', 10202'-9910', and 9715'-9326'. Set
CIBP @ 9800' with 10' of cement. TOC @ 9790'. See attached for details.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038

TITLE
 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 7 /3 /2014

July 31, 2014

Sundry Number: 52953 API Well Number: 43013311180000Sundry Number: 52953 API Well Number: 43013311180000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well POTTER 2-24B5

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY,L.P. 43013311180000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

2124 FSL 0922 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.0S Range: 05.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

6/26/2014
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Seebelow

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Swabbed perfs from 9326'-9715' 10202'-9910', and 9715'-9326'. Set' Accepted by the
CIBP @ 9800' with 10' of cement. TOC @ 9790'. See attached for detailS. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FORiß§iCOM ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 7/3/2014

RECEIVED: Jul. 03,

Sundry Number: 52953 API Well Number: 43013311180000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well POTTER 2-24B5

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY,L.P. 43013311180000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

2124 FSL 0922 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.0S Range: 05.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

6/26/2014
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Seebelow

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Swabbed perfs from 9326'-9715' 10202'-9910', and 9715'-9326'. Set' Accepted by the
CIBP @ 9800' with 10' of cement. TOC @ 9790'. See attached for detailS. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FORiß§iCOM ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 7/3/2014

RECEIVED: Jul. 03,



RECEIVED: Jul. 03, 2014

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s) does (do) 

not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the possession or use of the 

report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this report or any part thereof, is solely at 

the user’s own risk.

CENTRAL DIVISION

ALTAMONT FIELD

 POTTER 2-24B5

  POTTER 2-24B5

   WORKOVER LAND

Operation Summary Report

Sundry Number: 52953 API Well Number: 43013311180000Sundry Number: 52953 API Well Number: 43013311180000

CENTRAL DIVISION

ALTAMONT FIELD
POTTER 2-24B5
POTTER 2-24B5
WORKOVER LAND

Operation Summary Report

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s) does (do)
not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the possession or use of the
report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this report or any part thereof, is solely at
the user's own risk.

RECEIVED: Jul. 03,

Sundry Number: 52953 API Well Number: 43013311180000

CENTRAL DIVISION

ALTAMONT FIELD
POTTER 2-24B5
POTTER 2-24B5
WORKOVER LAND

Operation Summary Report

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s) does (do)
not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the possession or use of the
report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this report or any part thereof, is solely at
the user's own risk.

RECEIVED: Jul. 03,



RECEIVED: Jul. 03, 2014

CENTRAL DIVISION

1       General

1.1       Customer Information

CENTRAL DIVISIONCompany

Representative

Address

1.2       Well Information

POTTER 2-24B5Well

POTTER 2-24B5SiteALTAMONT FIELDProject

Event WORKOVER LANDRig Name/No.

Start date 6/10/2014 End date

8/5/1985Spud Date/Time UWI 024-002-S 005-W 30

Active datum KB @6,293.0usft (above Mean Sea Level)

Afe No./Description 163230/51893 / POTTER 2-24 B5

2       Summary

2.1       Operation Summary

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duration

(hr)

Phase Activit

y Code

Sub OP 

Code

MD from

(usft)

Operation

6/11/2014 12:30 14:30 2.00 MIRU 01 P TRAVEL TO LOC SPOT IN & RU PEAK 2100

14:30 16:30 2.00 WOR 16 P PUMP 60 BBLS DWN TBG, NDWH, NUBOP & HYDRILL, RU 

WORK FLOOR & TBG TONGS, SECURE WELL SDFN

6/12/2014  6:00  7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON RU SPOOLERS WRITE & 

REVIEW JSA'S

 7:30 16:00 8.50 WOR 39 P LD TBG HANGER 1 JT 2-7/8'' EUE 8rd TBG & 8' X 2-7/8'' TBG 

SUB, RU ESP SPOOLER & CAP TUBE SPOOLER, TOOH W/ 

63 JTS 2-7/8'' EUE 8rd TBG, 2-7/8'' EUE X 2-7/8'' DSS X OVER, 

228 JTS 2-7/8'' DSS, 2-7/8'' DSS X 2-7/8'' EUE X OVER, 1 JT 

2-7/8'' EUE 8rd, 2-7/8'' P.S.N., 2 JTS 2-7/8'' EUE 8rd, 2-7/8'' 

DRAIN SUB, 2 JTS 2-7/8'' EUE 8rd & LD 4' X 2-7/8'' TBG SUB, 4 

PUMPS, GAS SEP, TANDUM SEALS, MOTOR, SENSOR & 

2-3/8'' CHEM MANDREL, SPOOLING ESP CABLE & 3/8'' CAP 

TUBE, RD SPOOLERS

16:00 18:30 2.50 WOR 39 P TALLY MU & TIH W/ 7'' ON-OFF SKIRT, & 160 JTS 2-7/8'' TBG, 

SECURE WELL SDFN

6/13/2014  6:00  7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON TIH W/ TBG, WRITE & REVIEW 

JSA'S

 7:30  9:30 2.00 WOR 39 P 0 PSI ON WELL, CONT TIH W/ 144 JTS 2-7/8'' TBGLATCH 

ONTO & RELEASE 7'' PKR @ 9295'

 9:30 16:00 6.50 WOR 39 P TOOH W/ 304 JTS 2-7/8'' TBG, 7'' ON-OFF SKIRT, 7'' ARROW 

SET PKR, 2-7/8'' DESANDER, 8 JTS 2-7/8'' EUE N-80 TBG & 

2-7/8'' BULL PLUG

16:00 18:30 2.50 WOR 39 P MU & TIH W/ 6'' ROCK BIT, 7'' CSG SCRAPER, 5 JTS 2-7/8'' 

EUE N-80 8rd TBG, 2-7/8'' EUE X 2-7/8'' DSS X OVER & 228 

JTS 2-7/8'' DSS TBG, 2-7/8'' DSS x 2-7/8'' EUE X OVER & 30 

JTS 2-7/8'' EUE N-80 8rd TBG SECURE WELL SDFW

6/14/2014  6:00  6:00 24.00 WOR 18 P NO ACTIVITY SDFW

6/15/2014  6:00  6:00 24.00 WOR 18 P NO ACTIVITY SDFW

6/16/2014  6:00  6:00 24.00 WOR 18 P NO ACTIVITY SDFW

6/17/2014  6:00  7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON PU TBG, WRITE & REVIEW 

JSA'S

 7:30  9:30 2.00 WOR 24 P 0 PSI ON WELL, CONT TIH OUT OF DERRICK W/ 34 JTS, 

TALLY & PU 29 JTS 2-7/8'' WORK STRING TBG, TAG FILL @ 

10,021' LAY DWN 1 JT

 9:30 11:00 1.50 WOR 18 P RUN PUMP LINES FROM PUMP TO WELL HEAD, RU 

POWER SWIVEL

11:00 12:30 1.50 WOR 06 P BREAK CIRC W/ 146 BBLS 2% KCL, PUMPING 5BPM 

RETURNING 1/2 TO 3/4 BPM

 1July 03, 2014 at 10:01 am OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 52953 API Well Number: 43013311180000Sundry Number: 52953 API Well Number: 43013311180000

CENTRAL DIVISION

1 General

1.1 Customer Information

Company CENTRAL DIVISION
Representative
Address

1.2 Well Information

Well POTTER 2-24B5

Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site POTTER 2-24B5

Rig Name/No. Event WORKOVER LAND
Start date 6/10/2014 End date
Spud Date/Time 8/5/1985 UWI 024-002-S 005-W 30
Active datum KB @6,293.0usft(above Mean Sea Level)
Afe No.lDescription 163230/51893 / POTTER 2-24 B5

2 Summary

2.1 Operation Summary

Date Time Duration Phase Activit Sub OP MD from Operation
Start-End (hr) y Code Code (usft)

6/11/2014 12:30 14:30 2.00 MIRU 01 P TRAVEL TO LOC SPOT IN & RU PEAK 2100
14:30 16:30 2.00 WOR 16 P PUMP 60 BBLS DWN TBG, NDWH, NUBOP & HYDRILL, RU

WORK FLOOR & TBG TONGS, SECURE WELL SDFN
6/12/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON RU SPOOLERS WRITE &

REVIEW JSA'S
7:30 16:00 8.50 WOR 39 P LD TBG HANGER 1 JT 2-7/8" EUE 8rd TBG & 8'X 2-7/8" TBG

SUB, RU ESP SPOOLER & CAP TUBE SPOOLER, TOOH WI
63 JTS 2-7/8" EUE 8rd TBG, 2-7/8" EUE X 2-7/8" DSSX OVER,
228 JTS 2-7/8" DSS, 2-7/8" DSS X 2-7/8" EUE X OVER, 1 JT
2-7/8" EUE 8rd, 2-7/8" P.S.N., 2 JTS 2-7/8" EUE 8rd, 2-7/8"
DRAIN SUB, 2 JTS 2-7/8" EUE 8rd & LD 4'X 2-7/8" TBG SUB, 4
PUMPS, GAS SEP, TANDUM SEALS, MOTOR, SENSOR &
2-3/8" CHEM MANDREL, SPOOLING ESP CABLE & 3/8" CAP
TUBE, RD SPOOLERS

16:00 18:30 2.50 WOR 39 P TALLYMU & TlH W/ 7" ON-OFF SKIRT, & 160 JTS 2-7/8" TBG,
SECURE WELL SDFN

6/13/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON TlH WITBG, WRITE & REVIEW
JSA'S

7:30 9:30 2.00 WOR 39 P 0 PSI ON WELL, CONT TlH W/ 144 JTS 2-7/8" TBGLATCH
ONTO & RELEASE 7" PKR @ 9295'

9:30 16:00 6.50 WOR 39 P TOOH WI 304 JTS 2-7/8" TBG, 7" ON-OFF SKIRT, 7" ARROW
SET PKR, 2-7/8" DESANDER, 8 JTS 2-7/8" EUE N-80 TBG &
2-7/8" BULL PLUG

16:00 18:30 2.50 WOR 39 P MU & TlH W/ 6" ROCK BIT, 7" CSG SCRAPER, 5 JTS 2-7/8"
EUE N-80 8rd TBG, 2-7/8" EUE X 2-7/8" DSSX OVER & 228
JTS 2-7/8" DSS TBG, 2-7/8" DSS x 2-7/8" EUE X OVER & 30
JTS 2-7/8" EUE N-80 8rd TBG SECURE WELL SDFW

6/14/2014 6:00 6:00 24.00 WOR 18 P NO ACTIVITY SDFW
6/15/2014 6:00 6:00 24.00 WOR 18 P NO ACTIVITY SDFW
6/16/2014 6:00 6:00 24.00 WOR 18 P NO ACTIVITY SDFW
6/17/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON PU TBG, WRITE & REVIEW

JSA'S
7:30 9:30 2.00 WOR 24 P 0 PSI ON WELL, CONT TlH OUT OF DERRICK W/ 34 JTS,

TALLY& PU 29 JTS 2-7/8" WORK STRING TBG, TAG FILL @
10,021' LAYDWN 1 JT

9:30 11:00 1.50 WOR 18 P RUN PUMP LINES FROM PUMP TO WELL HEAD, RU
POWER SWlVEL

11:00 12:30 1.50 WOR 06 P BREAK CIRC W/ 146 BBLS 2% KCL, PUMPING 5BPM
RETURNING 1/2 TO 3/4 BPM

July 03, 2014 at 10:01 am 1 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Jul. 03,

Sundry Number: 52953 API Well Number: 43013311180000

CENTRAL DIVISION

1 General

1.1 Customer Information

Company CENTRAL DIVISION

Representative

Address

1.2 Well Information

Well POTTER 2-24B5

Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site POTTER 2-24B5

Rig Name/No. Event WORKOVER LAND

Start date 6/10/2014 End date
Spud Date/Time 8/5/1985 UWI 024-002-5 OO5-W30

Active datum KB @6,293.Ousft (above Mean Sea Level)
Afe No.lDescription 163230/51893 / POTTER 2-24 B5

2 Summary

2.1 Operation Summary

Date Time Duration Phase Activit Sub OP MD from Operation
Start-End (hr) y Code Code (usft)

6/11/2014 12:30 14:30 2.00 MIRU 01 P TRAVEL TO LOC SPOT IN & RU PEAK2100
14:30 16:30 2.00 WOR 16 P PUMP60 BBLS DWN TBG, NDWH, NUBOP & HYDRILL, RU

WORK FLOOR & TBG TONGS, SECURE WELL SDFN
6/12/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON RU SPOOLERS WRITE &

REVIEW JSA'S
7:30 16:00 8.50 WOR 39 P LD TBG HANGER 1 JT 2-7/8" EUE 8rd TBG & 8'X 2-7/8" TBG

SUB, RU ESP SPOOLER & CAP TUBE SPOOLER, TOOH W/
63 JTS 2-7/8" EUE 8rd TBG, 2-7/8" EUE X 2-7/8" DSS X OVER,
228 JTS 2-7/8" DSS, 2-7/8" DSS X 2-7/8" EUE X OVER, 1 JT
2-7/8" EUE 8rd, 2-7/8" P.S.N., 2 JTS 2-7/8" EUE 8rd, 2-7/8"
DRAIN SUB, 2 JTS 2-7/8" EUE 8rd & LD 4'X 2-7/8" TBG SUB, 4
PUMPS, GAS SEP, TANDUM SEALS, MOTOR, SENSOR &
2-3/8" CHEM MANDREL, SPOOLING ESP CABLE & 3/8" CAP
TUBE, RD SPOOLERS

16:00 18:30 2.50 WOR 39 P TALLYMU & TlH W/ 7" ON-OFF SKIRT, & 160 JTS 2-7/8" TBG,
SECURE WELL SDFN

6/13/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON TlH WITBG, WRITE & REVIEW
JSA'S

7:30 9:30 2.00 WOR 39 P O PSI ON WELL, CONT TlH W/ 144 JTS 2-7/8" TBGLATCH
ONTO & RELEASE 7" PKR @ 9295'

9:30 16:00 6.50 WOR 39 P TOOH W/ 304 JTS 2-7/8" TBG, 7" ON-OFF SKIRT, 7" ARROW
SET PKR, 2-7/8" DESANDER, 8 JTS 2-7/8" EUE N-80 TBG &
2-7/8" BULL PLUG

16:00 18:30 2.50 WOR 39 P MU & TlH W/ 6" ROCK BIT, 7" CSG SCRAPER, 5 JTS 2-7/8"
EUE N-80 8rd TBG, 2-7/8" EUE X 2-7/8" DSS X OVER & 228
JTS 2-7/8" DSS TBG, 2-7/8" DSS x 2-7/8" EUE X OVER & 30
JTS 2-7/8" EUE N-80 8rd TBG SECURE WELL SDFW

6/14/2014 6:00 6:00 24.00 WOR 18 P NO ACTIVITY SDFW

6/15/2014 6:00 6:00 24.00 WOR 18 P NO ACTIVITY SDFW

6/16/2014 6:00 6:00 24.00 WOR 18 P NO ACTIVITY SDFW
6/17/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON PU TBG, WRITE & REVIEW

JSA'S
7:30 9:30 2.00 WOR 24 P O PSI ON WELL, CONT TlH OUT OF DERRICK W/ 34 JTS,

TALLY& PU 29 JTS 2-7/8" WORK STRING TBG, TAG FILL @
10,021' LAY DWN 1 JT

9:30 11:00 1.50 WOR 18 P RUN PUMP LINES FROM PUMPTO WELL HEAD, RU
POWER SWIVEL

11:00 12:30 1.50 WOR 06 P BREAK CIRC W/ 146 BBLS 2% KCL, PUMPING 5BPM
RETURNING 1/2 TO 3/4 BPM

July 03, 2014 at 10:01 am 1 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Jul. 03,



RECEIVED: Jul. 03, 2014

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duration

(hr)

Phase Activit

y Code

Sub OP 

Code

MD from

(usft)

Operation

12:30 14:30 2.00 WOR 10 P ATTEMPT TO CLEAN OUT KEPT ON LOSING CIRC, PUMP 

UNTIL RETURNS CLEAN PUMPED 638 BBLS, RETURNING 

FRAC SAND ( CLEANED OUT FROM 10,021' TO 10,028' )

14:30 16:00 1.50 WOR 39 P RD POWER SWIVEL TOOH ABOVE PERFS W/ 24 JTS 2-7/8'' 

TBG EOT @ 9322', MOVE IN & HOOK UP ANOTHER RIG 

PUMP & FARC TANK SECURE WELL SDFD, FILL FRAC 

TANKS W/ 2% KCL

6/18/2014  6:00  7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON OVER HEAD LOADS WRITE & 

REVIEW JSA'S

 7:30 11:00 3.50 WOR 10 P 0 PSI ON WELL TIH W/ 24 JTS 2-7/8'' TBG, RU POWER 

SWIVEL, PU 1 JT, BREAK CIRC W/ 52 BBLS 2% KCL, CLEAN 

OUT FROM 10028' TO 10046' FELL THRU BRIDGE, CIRC TBG 

CLEAN

11:00 15:00 4.00 WOR 10 P SWIVEL IN HOLE W/ 7 JTS 2-7/8'' EUE N-80 TBG, TAG LINER 

TOP @ 10297' TBGM (19' DEEP), LD 1 JT 2-7/8'' TBG W/ 

SWIVEL, RD POWER SWIVEL, TOOH W/ 333 JTS 2-7/8'' TBG, 

7'' CSG SCRAPER & 6'' BIT, FLUSHING TBG AS NEEDED W/ 

HOT OILER

15:00 18:00 3.00 WOR 39 P MIRU HYDRO TEST EQUIP, MU & RIH W/ 7'' TS RBP, 7'' RET 

HEAD, 4' X 2-7/8'' TBG SUB, 7'' HD PKR, 2-7/8'' +45 P.S.N., 5 

JTS 2-7/8'' EUE N-80 TBG, 2-7/8'' EUE X 2-7/8'' DSS X OVER & 

138 JTS 2-7/8'' DSS N-80 TBG TESTING TO 8500 PSI, 

SECURE WELL SDFN

6/19/2014  6:00  7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW 

JSA TOPIC; HYDROTESTING TBG

 7:00 11:00 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P CISP 0 PSI TSIP 0 PSI CONTINUE HYDROTEST TBG TTL OF 

313 JTS ALL JOINTS TESTED R/D HYDROTEST TOOLS

11:00 18:00 7.00 PRDHEQ 38 P SET RBP AT 9800' PKR AT 9300' R/U SWAB PERFS FROM 

9326'-9715' SWABBED TTL OF 233 BBLS COLLECTED FLUID 

SAMPLES WATER w A TRACE OF OIL R/D SWAB SECURE 

WELL SDFN

6/20/2014  6:00  7:00 1.00 SW 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW 

JSA TOPIC; SWAB TESTING

 7:00  9:00 2.00 SW 27 P CSIP 0 PSI TSIP 0 PSI RELEASE PKR TIH ATTEMPT TO 

RELEASE PLUG FAILED UNABLE TO GET ON/OFF TOOL TO 

LATCH R/U KELLY PUMP DOWN TBG ENGAGE AND 

RELEASE PLUG TIH AND RESET PLUG AT 10250' TOH SET 

PKR AT 9850'

 9:00 18:00 9.00 SW 38 P R/U SWAB PERFS FROM 10202'-9910' SWABBED TTL OF 

421 BBLS COLLECTED FLUID SAMPLES WATER w A TRACE 

OF OIL R/D SWAB SECURE WELL SDFN

6/21/2014  6:00  7:00 1.00 SW 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW 

JSA TOPIC; SWAB TESTING

 7:00 17:00 10.00 SW 38 P CSIP 0 PSI CSIP 0 PSI R/U SWAB PERFS FROM 10202'-9910' 

SWABBED TTL OF 524 BBLS COLLECTED FLUID SAMPLES 

WATER w A TRACE OF OIL R/D SWAB

17:00 18:00 1.00 SW 38 P MOVE TOOLS RELEASE PKR TIH RETRIEVE PLUG TOH AND 

SET PLUG AT 9800' SET PLK AT 9300' SECURE WELL SDFN

6/24/2014  6:00  7:00 1.00 SW 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW 

JSA TOPIC; SWAB TESTING

 7:00 18:00 11.00 SW 38 P CSIP 0 PSI CSIP 0 PSI R/U SWAB PERFS FROM 9715'-9326' 

SWABBED TTL OF446 BBLS COLLECTED FLUID SAMPLES 

WATER w A TRACE OF OIL R/D SWAB SECUREW WELL 

SDFN

6/25/2014  6:00  7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW 

JSA TOPIC; TRIPPING TOOLS

 7:00 11:30 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RELEASE 7" PKR TIH RETRIEVE 7" PLUG TOH L/D 47 JTS 

OF 2 7/8" TBG L/D PKR AND PLUG

 2July 03, 2014 at 10:01 am OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 52953 API Well Number: 43013311180000Sundry Number: 52953 API Well Number: 43013311180000

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duration Phase Activit Sub OP MD from Operation
Start-End (hr) y Code Code (usft)

12:30 14:30 2.00 WOR 10 P ATTEMPT TO CLEAN OUT KEPT ON LOSING CIRC, PUMP
UNTIL RETURNS CLEAN PUMPED 638 BBLS, RETURNING
FRAC SAND ( CLEANED OUT FROM 10,021' TO 10,028' )

14:30 16:00 1.50 WOR 39 P RD POWER SWIVEL TOOH ABOVE PERFS Wl24 JTS 2-7/8"
TBG EOT @ 9322', MOVE IN & HOOK UP ANOTHER RIG
PUMP & FARC TANK SECURE WELL SDFD, FILL FRAC
TANKS W/ 2% KCL

6/18/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON OVER HEAD LOADS WRITE &
REVIEW JSA'S

7:30 11:00 3.50 WOR 10 P O PSI ON WELL TlH Wl24 JTS 2-7/8" TBG, RU POWER
SWIVEL, PU 1 JT, BREAK CIRC W/ 52 BBLS 2% KCL, CLEAN
OUT FROM 10028' TO 10046' FELL THRU BRIDGE, CIRC TBG
CLEAN

11:00 15:00 4.00 WOR 10 P SWIVEL IN HOLE Wl7 JTS 2-7/8" EUE N-80 TBG, TAG LINER
TOP @ 10297' TBGM (19' DEEP), LD 1 JT 2-7/8" TBG W/
SWIVEL, RD POWER SWIVEL, TOOH W/ 333 JTS 2-7/8" TBG,
7" CSG SCRAPER & 6" BIT, FLUSHING TBG AS NEEDED W/
HOT OILER

15:00 18:00 3.00 WOR 39 P MIRU HYDRO TEST EQUIP, MU & RIH W/7" TS RBP, 7" RET
HEAD, 4'X 2-7/8" TBG SUB, 7" HD PKR, 2-7/8" +45 P.S.N., 5
JTS 2-7/8" EUE N-80 TBG, 2-7/8" EUE X 2-7/8" DSS X OVER &
138 JTS 2-7/8" DSS N-80 TBG TESTING TO 8500 PSI,
SECURE WELL SDFN

6/19/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW
JSA TOPIC; HYDROTESTING TBG

7:00 11:00 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P CISPO PSI TSIPO PSI CONTINUE HYDROTEST TBG TTL OF
313 JTS ALL JOINTS TESTED R/D HYDROTEST TOOLS

11:00 18:00 7.00 PRDHEQ 38 P SET RBPAT9800' PKRAT 9300' R/U SWAB PERFS FROM
9326'-9715' SWABBED TTL OF 233 BBLS COLLECTED FLUID
SAMPLES WATER w A TRACE OF OIL R/D SWAB SECURE
WELL SDFN

6/20/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 SW 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW
JSA TOPIC; SWAB TESTING

7:00 9:00 2.00 SW 27 P CSIP O PSI TSIP O PSI RELEASE PKR TlH ATTEMPT TO
RELEASE PLUG FAILED UNABLE TO GET ONIOFF TOOL TO
LATCH R/U KELLY PUMP DOWN TBG ENGAGE AND
RELEASE PLUG TlH AND RESET PLUG AT 10250' TOH SET
PKR AT 9850'

9:00 18:00 9.00 SW 38 P R/U SWAB PERFS FROM 10202'-9910' SWABBED TTL OF
421 BBLS COLLECTED FLUID SAMPLES WATER w A TRACE
OF OIL R/D SWAB SECURE WELL SDFN

6/21/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 SW 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW
JSA TOPIC; SWAB TESTING

7:00 17:00 10.00 SW 38 P CSIPO PSI CSIPO PSI R/U SWAB PERFS FROM 10202'-9910'
SWABBED TTL OF 524 BBLS COLLECTED FLUID SAMPLES
WATER w A TRACE OF OIL R/D SWAB

17:00 18:00 1.00 SW 38 P MOVE TOOLS RELEASE PKR TlH RETRIEVE PLUG TOH AND
SET PLUG AT 9800' SET PLKAT 9300' SECURE WELL SDFN

6/24/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 SW 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW
JSA TOPIC; SWAB TESTING

7:00 18:00 11.00 SW 38 P CSIPO PSI CSIPO PSI R/U SWAB PERFS FROM 9715'-9326'
SWABBED TTL OF446 BBLS COLLECTED FLUID SAMPLES
WATER w A TRACE OF OIL R/D SWAB SECUREW WELL
SDFN

6/25/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW
JSA TOPIC; TRIPPING TOOLS

7:00 11:30 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RELEASE 7" PKR TlH RETRIEVE 7" PLUG TOH L/D 47 JTS
OF 2 7/8" TBG L/D PKRAND PLUG

July 03, 2014 at 10:01 am 2 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Jul. 03,

Sundry Number: 52953 API Well Number: 43013311180000

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duration Phase Activit Sub OP MD from Operation
Start-End (hr) y Code Code (usft)

12:30 14:30 2.00 WOR 10 P ATTEMPT TO CLEAN OUT KEPT ON LOSING CIRC, PUMP
UNTIL RETURNS CLEAN PUMPED 638 BBLS, RETURNING
FRAC SAND ( CLEANED OUT FROM 10,021' TO 10,028' )

14:30 16:00 1.50 WOR 39 P RD POWER SWIVEL TOOH ABOVE PERFS Wl24 JTS 2-7/8"
TBG EOT @ 9322', MOVE IN & HOOK UP ANOTHER RIG
PUMP & FARC TANK SECURE WELL SDFD, FILL FRAC
TANKS W/ 2% KCL

6/18/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON OVER HEAD LOADS WRITE &
REVIEW JSA'S

7:30 11:00 3.50 WOR 10 P O PSI ON WELL TlH Wl24 JTS 2-7/8" TBG, RU POWER
SWIVEL, PU 1 JT, BREAK CIRC W/ 52 BBLS 2% KCL, CLEAN
OUT FROM 10028' TO 10046' FELL THRU BRIDGE, CIRC TBG
CLEAN

11:00 15:00 4.00 WOR 10 P SWIVEL IN HOLE Wl7 JTS 2-7/8" EUE N-80 TBG, TAG LINER
TOP @ 10297' TBGM (19' DEEP), LD 1 JT 2-7/8" TBG W/
SWIVEL, RD POWER SWIVEL, TOOH W/ 333 JTS 2-7/8" TBG,
7" CSG SCRAPER & 6" BIT, FLUSHING TBG AS NEEDED W/
HOT OILER

15:00 18:00 3.00 WOR 39 P MIRU HYDRO TEST EQUIP, MU & RIH W/7" TS RBP, 7" RET
HEAD, 4'X 2-7/8" TBG SUB, 7" HD PKR, 2-7/8" +45 P.S.N., 5
JTS 2-7/8" EUE N-80 TBG, 2-7/8" EUE X 2-7/8" DSS X OVER &
138 JTS 2-7/8" DSS N-80 TBG TESTING TO 8500 PSI,
SECURE WELL SDFN

6/19/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW
JSA TOPIC; HYDROTESTING TBG

7:00 11:00 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P CISPO PSI TSIPO PSI CONTINUE HYDROTEST TBG TTL OF
313 JTS ALL JOINTS TESTED R/D HYDROTEST TOOLS

11:00 18:00 7.00 PRDHEQ 38 P SET RBPAT9800' PKRAT 9300' R/U SWAB PERFS FROM
9326'-9715' SWABBED TTL OF 233 BBLS COLLECTED FLUID
SAMPLES WATER w A TRACE OF OIL R/D SWAB SECURE
WELL SDFN

6/20/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 SW 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW
JSA TOPIC; SWAB TESTING

7:00 9:00 2.00 SW 27 P CSIP O PSI TSIP O PSI RELEASE PKR TlH ATTEMPT TO
RELEASE PLUG FAILED UNABLE TO GET ONIOFF TOOL TO
LATCH R/U KELLY PUMP DOWN TBG ENGAGE AND
RELEASE PLUG TlH AND RESET PLUG AT 10250' TOH SET
PKR AT 9850'

9:00 18:00 9.00 SW 38 P R/U SWAB PERFS FROM 10202'-9910' SWABBED TTL OF
421 BBLS COLLECTED FLUID SAMPLES WATER w A TRACE
OF OIL R/D SWAB SECURE WELL SDFN

6/21/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 SW 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW
JSA TOPIC; SWAB TESTING

7:00 17:00 10.00 SW 38 P CSIPO PSI CSIPO PSI R/U SWAB PERFS FROM 10202'-9910'
SWABBED TTL OF 524 BBLS COLLECTED FLUID SAMPLES
WATER w A TRACE OF OIL R/D SWAB

17:00 18:00 1.00 SW 38 P MOVE TOOLS RELEASE PKR TlH RETRIEVE PLUG TOH AND
SET PLUG AT 9800' SET PLKAT 9300' SECURE WELL SDFN

6/24/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 SW 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW
JSA TOPIC; SWAB TESTING

7:00 18:00 11.00 SW 38 P CSIPO PSI CSIPO PSI R/U SWAB PERFS FROM 9715'-9326'
SWABBED TTL OF446 BBLS COLLECTED FLUID SAMPLES
WATER w A TRACE OF OIL R/D SWAB SECUREW WELL
SDFN

6/25/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW
JSA TOPIC; TRIPPING TOOLS

7:00 11:30 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RELEASE 7" PKR TlH RETRIEVE 7" PLUG TOH L/D 47 JTS
OF 2 7/8" TBG L/D PKRAND PLUG

July 03, 2014 at 10:01 am 2 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Jul. 03,



RECEIVED: Jul. 03, 2014

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duration

(hr)

Phase Activit

y Code

Sub OP 

Code

MD from

(usft)

Operation

11:30 15:30 4.00 WLWORK 27 P HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA TOPIC; WIRELINE. MIRU 

WIRELINE TIH AND SET 7" CIBP AT 9800' TOH L/D SETTING 

TOOL MIX CMT P/U DUMP BAILER TIH DUMP BAIL 10' OF 

CMT TOC AT 9790' TOH L/D BAILER RDMO WIRELINE 

SECURE WELL

15:30 16:00 0.50 WOR 18 P PREPARE LOCATION TO P/U ESP EQUIPMENT SDFN

6/26/2014  6:00  7:00 1.00 INARTLT 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW 

JSA TOPIC; TRIPPING TBG

 7:00 11:00 4.00 INARTLT 03 P P/U ESP EQUIPMENT; CHEM MANDREL SENSOR  TAND 

SEALS GAS SEPERATOR 6' X 2 7/8" TBG SUB 2-JTS OF 2 

7/8" N-80 TBG DRAIN SUB 2-JTS OF 2 7/8" N-80 TBG 2 7/8" 

PSN 1-JTS COLLAR STOP XO 2 7/8" N-80 X 2 7/8" DSS

11:00 19:00 8.00 INARTLT 03 P TIH w 228 JTS OF DSS 2 7/8" TBG XO 63 JTS OF 2 7/8" N-80 

TBG BANDING CABLE AND CAPILLARY STRING LAND TBG 

SECURE WELL SDFN

6/27/2014  6:00  7:00 1.00 INARTLT 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW 

JSA TOPIC; NIPPLE DOWN NIPPLE UP

 7:00 10:00 3.00 INARTLT 16 P SPLICE BOTTOM LEAD FILL CAP STRING w CHEMICAL 

LAND TBG N/D HYDRILL N/D BOPE N/U WELL HEAD

10:00 12:00 2.00 RDMO 02 P RDMO CLEAN LOCATION START PUMP AT 10:45 PUMPED 

UP IN 5 MIN TURN WELL OVER TO PRODUCTION

 3July 03, 2014 at 10:01 am OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 52953 API Well Number: 43013311180000Sundry Number: 52953 API Well Number: 43013311180000

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duration Phase Activit Sub OP MD from Operation
Start-End (hr) y Code Code (usft)

11:30 15:30 4.00 WLWORK 27 P HSM WRITE AND REVIEWJSATOPIC; WIRELINE. MIRU
WIRELINE TlH AND SET 7" CIBPAT 9800' TOH L/D SETTING
TOOL MIX CMT P/U DUMP BAILER TlH DUMP BAIL 10' OF
CMT TOCAT 9790' TOH L/D BAILER RDMO WIRELINE
SECURE WELL

15:30 16:00 0.50 WOR 18 P PREPARE LOCATION TO P/U ESP EQUIPMENT SDFN
6/26/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 INARTLT 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW

JSA TOPIC; TRIPPING TBG
7:00 11:00 4.00 INARTLT 03 P P/U ESP EQUIPMENT; CHEM MANDREL SENSOR TAND

SEALS GAS SEPERATOR 6'X 2 7/8" TBG SUB 2-JTS OF 2
7/8" N-80 TBG DRAIN SUB 2-JTS OF 2 7/8" N-80 TBG 2 7/8"
PSN 1-JTS COLLAR STOPXO 2 7/8" N-80 X 2 7/8" DSS

11:00 19:00 8.00 INARTLT 03 P TlH w 228 JTS OF DSS 2 7/8" TBG XO 63 JTS OF 2 7/8" N-80
TBG BANDING CABLE AND CAPILLARY STRING LAND TBG
SECURE WELL SDFN

6/27/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 INARTLT 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW
JSATOPIC; NIPPLE DOWN NIPPLE UP

7:00 10:00 3.00 INARTLT 16 P SPLICE BOTTOM LEAD FILL CAP STRING w CHEMICAL
LAND TBG N/D HYDRILL N/D BOPE N/U WELL HEAD

10:00 12:00 2.00 RDMO 02 P RDMO CLEAN LOCATION START PUMPAT 10:45 PUMPED
UP IN 5 MIN TURN WELL OVER TO PRODUCTION

July 03, 2014 at 10:01 am 3 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Jul. 03,

Sundry Number: 52953 API Well Number: 43013311180000

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duration Phase Activit Sub OP MD from Operation
Start-End (hr) y Code Code (usft)

11:30 15:30 4.00 WLWORK 27 P HSM WRITE AND REVIEWJSATOPIC; WIRELINE. MIRU
WIRELINE TlH AND SET 7" CIBPAT 9800' TOH L/D SETTING
TOOL MIX CMT P/U DUMP BAILER TlH DUMP BAIL 10' OF
CMT TOCAT 9790' TOH L/D BAILER RDMO WIRELINE
SECURE WELL

15:30 16:00 0.50 WOR 18 P PREPARE LOCATION TO P/U ESP EQUIPMENT SDFN

6/26/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 INARTLT 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW
JSA TOPIC; TRIPPING TBG

7:00 11:00 4.00 INARTLT 03 P P/U ESP EQUIPMENT; CHEM MANDREL SENSOR TAND
SEALS GAS SEPERATOR 6'X 2 7/8" TBG SUB 2-JTS OF 2
7/8" N-80 TBG DRAIN SUB 2-JTS OF 2 7/8" N-80 TBG 2 7/8"
PSN 1-JTS COLLAR STOPXO 2 7/8" N-80 X 2 7/8" DSS

11:00 19:00 8.00 INARTLT 03 P TlH w 228 JTS OF DSS 2 7/8" TBG XO 63 JTS OF 2 7/8" N-80
TBG BANDING CABLE AND CAPILLARY STRING LAND TBG
SECURE WELL SDFN

6/27/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 INARTLT 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW
JSATOPIC; NIPPLE DOWN NIPPLE UP

7:00 10:00 3.00 INARTLT 16 P SPLICE BOTTOM LEAD FILL CAP STRING w CHEMICAL
LAND TBG N/D HYDRILL N/D BOPE N/U WELL HEAD

10:00 12:00 2.00 RDMO 02 P RDMO CLEAN LOCATION START PUMPAT 10:45 PUMPED
UP IN 5 MIN TURN WELL OVER TO PRODUCTION

July 03, 2014 at 10:01 am 3 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Jul. 03,
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RECEIVED: Feb. 12, 2015

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 POTTER 2-24B5 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43013311180000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2124 FSL 0922 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.0S Range: 05.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

11 /5 /2014

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  Downsize

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Downsized ESP. See attached for details.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038

TITLE
 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 2 /12 /2015

February 17, 2015

Sundry Number: 60880 API Well Number: 43013311180000Sundry Number: 60880 API Well Number: 43013311180000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well POTTER 2-24B5

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY,L.P. 43013311180000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

2124 FSL 0922 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWSW Section: 24 Township: 02.0S Range: 05.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

1 1/5 /2 0 14
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Downsize

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Downsized ESP. See attached for details. Accepted by the
utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
February 17, 2015

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 2/12/2015

RECEIVED: Feb. 12,



RECEIVED: Feb. 12, 2015

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD from

(ft)

Operation

 7:00 11:30 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RELEASE 7" PKR TIH RETRIEVE 7" PLUG TOH L/D 47 JTS OF 2 

7/8" TBG L/D PKR AND PLUG

11:30 15:30 4.00 WLWORK 27 P HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA TOPIC; WIRELINE. MIRU WIRELINE 

TIH AND SET 7" CIBP AT 9800' TOH L/D SETTING TOOL MIX CMT 

P/U DUMP BAILER TIH DUMP BAIL 10' OF CMT TOC AT 9790' TOH 

L/D BAILER RDMO WIRELINE SECURE WELL

15:30 16:00 0.50 WOR 18 P PREPARE LOCATION TO P/U ESP EQUIPMENT SDFN

6/26/2014  6:00  7:00 1.00 INARTLT 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA 

TOPIC; TRIPPING TBG

 7:00 11:00 4.00 INARTLT 03 P P/U ESP EQUIPMENT; CHEM MANDREL SENSOR  TAND SEALS 

GAS SEPERATOR 6' X 2 7/8" TBG SUB 2-JTS OF 2 7/8" N-80 

TBG DRAIN SUB 2-JTS OF 2 7/8" N-80 TBG 2 7/8" PSN 1-JTS 

COLLAR STOP XO 2 7/8" N-80 X 2 7/8" DSS

11:00 19:00 8.00 INARTLT 03 P TIH w 228 JTS OF DSS 2 7/8" TBG XO 63 JTS OF 2 7/8" N-80 

TBG BANDING CABLE AND CAPILLARY STRING LAND TBG 

SECURE WELL SDFN

6/27/2014  6:00  7:00 1.00 INARTLT 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA 

TOPIC; NIPPLE DOWN NIPPLE UP

 7:00 10:00 3.00 INARTLT 16 P SPLICE BOTTOM LEAD FILL CAP STRING w CHEMICAL LAND 

TBG N/D HYDRILL N/D BOPE N/U WELL HEAD

10:00 12:00 2.00 RDMO 02 P RDMO CLEAN LOCATION START PUMP AT 10:45 PUMPED UP IN 5 

MIN TURN WELL OVER TO PRODUCTION

11/1/2014 14:00 16:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 18 P ROAD RIG FROM 2-19C4 TO 2-24B5, MIRU

16:00 18:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 18 P BLOW DOWN TBG, ND WELLHEAD, NU 5K BOPE & HYDRILL, 

R/U WORK FLOOR, SECURE WELL, SDFD

11/2/2014  6:00  6:00 25.00 PRDHEQ 18 P NO ACTIVITY, SHUT DOWN  FOR WEEKEND

11/3/2014  6:00  6:00 24.00 PRDHEQ 18 P NO ACTIVITY, SHUT DOWN FOR WEEKEND

11/4/2014  6:00  7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 46 P CREW TRAVEL HSM WRITE & REVIEW JSA ( TOPIC ) POOH W/ 

ESP & HANGING SHEAVES

 7:00  9:00 2.00 PMPNG 24 P BLEED WELL, R/U HOTOILER FLUSH TBG W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL

 9:00 10:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P WORK LANDING PINS FREE, P/U ON TBG HANGER, R/U 

SPOOLERS

10:30 11:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P TOOH W/ 2 JTS AND PINCHED CABLE

11:30 12:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P FIX BAD SPOT IN CABLE

12:00 17:00 5.00 PRDHEQ 18 P TOOH W/ 61 JTS 2 7/8" 8rd, 8rd X DSS X-O, 228 JTS 2 7/8" DSS, 

DSS X 8RD X-O, COLLAR STOP, 1 JT 2 7/8" 8RD, DRAIN SUB, 2 

JTS 2 7/8", FLUSH PUMP W/ 15 BBLS, L/D ESP, TOP PUMP WAS 

LOCK UP, 2ND & 3RD PUMP WERE HARD TO TURN, 4TH PUMP & 

GAS SEP TURN FREE, POT HEAD, MOTOR LEAD & BTM 200' OF 

CABLE WERE BURNT, SECURE WELL, SDFD

11/5/2014  6:30  7:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 46 P SAFETY MEETING,

 7:00  8:45 1.75 PRDHEQ 38 P ASSEMBLE ESP, PREP FOR RIH

 8:45 11:00 2.25 PRDHEQ 38 N KINKED CABLE, CUT AND SPLICE

11:00 16:45 5.75 PRDHEQ 38 P RIH  W/ESP, CABLE AND CAP.

16:45 17:30 0.75 PRDHEQ 38 N DAMAGED CABLE WITH SLIPS, SPLICE. EOT: 6,650'

17:30 18:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 38 P SWFN

11/6/2014  6:30  7:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 46 P SAFETY MEETING

 7:00  9:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 38 P RIH W/ ESP. PMPD 60 BBLS 2% KCL IN FLOWLINE FOR PREP

 9:30 11:15 1.75 PRDHEQ 38 P SPLICE IN 2ND SPOOL

11:15 12:15 1.00 PRDHEQ 38 P RIH, NU CAPSTRING

12:15 13:30 1.25 PRDHEQ 38 P NUWH, PMPD 15 GAL. SCALE INHIBITOR

13:30 14:10 0.67 PRDHEQ 38 P RDMO, TURN TO PRODUCTION

 3January 26, 2015 at 11:37 am OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 60880 API Well Number: 43013311180000Sundry Number: 60880 API Well Number: 43013311180000

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
7:00 11:30 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RELEASE 7" PKR TlH RETRIEVE 7" PLUG TOH L/D 47 JTS OF 2

7/8" TBG L/D PKR AND PLUG
11:30 15:30 4.00 WLWORK 27 P HSM WRITE AND REVIEWJSATOPIC; WIRELINE. MIRU WIRELINE

TlH AND SET 7" CIBPAT 9800' TOH L/D SETTING TOOL MIX CMT
P/U DUMP BAILER TlH DUMP BAIL 10' OF CMT TOCAT 9790' TOH
L/D BAILER RDMO WIRELINE SECURE WELL

15:30 16:00 0.50 WOR 18 P PREPARE LOCATION TO P/U ESP EQUIPMENT SDFN

6/26/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 INARTLT 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA
TOPIC; TRIPPING TBG

7:00 11:00 4.00 INARTLT 03 P P/U ESP EQUIPMENT; CHEM MANDREL SENSOR TAND SEALS
GAS SEPERATOR 6' X 2 7/8" TBG SUB 2-JTS OF 2 7/8" N-80

TBG DRAIN SUB2-JTS OF 2 7/8" N-80 TBG 2 7/8" PSN 1-JTS

COLLAR STOP XO 2 7/8" N-80 X 2 7/8" DSS
11:00 19:00 8.00 INARTLT 03 P TlH w 228 JTS OF DSS 2 7/8" TBG XO 63 JTS OF 2 7/8" N-80

TBG BANDING CABLE AND CAPILLARY STRING LAND TBG
SECURE WELL SDFN

6/27/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 INARTLT 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA
TOPIC; NIPPLE DOWN NIPPLE UP

7:00 10:00 3.00 INARTLT 16 P SPLICE BOTTOM LEAD FILL CAP STRING w CHEMICAL LAND
TBG N/D HYDRILL N/D BOPE N/U WELL HEAD

10:00 12:00 2.00 RDMO 02 P RDMO CLEAN LOCATION START PUMPAT 10:45 PUMPED UP IN 5
MIN TURN WELL OVER TO PRODUCTION

11/1/2014 14:00 16:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 18 P ROAD RIG FROM 2-19C4 TO 2-24B5, MIRU

16:00 18:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 18 P BLOW DOWN TBG, ND WELLHEAD, NU 5K BOPE & HYDRILL,
R/U WORK FLOOR, SECURE WELL, SDFD

11/2/2014 6:00 6:00 25.00 PRDHEQ 18 P NO ACTIVITY, SHUT DOWN FOR WEEKEND

11/3/2014 6:00 6:00 24.00 PRDHEQ 18 P NO ACTIVITY, SHUT DOWN FOR WEEKEND

11/4/2014 6:00 7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 46 P CREW TRAVEL HSM WRITE & REVIEW JSA (TOPIC ) POOH W/
ESP & HANGING SHEAVES

7:00 9:00 2.00 PMPNG 24 P BLEED WELL, R/U HOTOILER FLUSH TBG Wl60 BBLS2% KCL
9:00 10:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P WORK LANDING PINS FREE, P/U ON TBG HANGER, R/U

SPOOLERS
10:30 11:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P TOOH Wl2 JTSAND PINCHED CABLE

11:30 12:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P FIX BAD SPOT IN CABLE

12:00 17:00 5.00 PRDHEQ 18 P TOOH W/ 61 JTS 2 7/8" 8rd, 8rd X DSS X-O, 228 JTS 2 7/8" DSS,
DSS X 8RD X-O, COLLAR STOP, 1 JT 2 7/8" 8RD, DRAIN SUB, 2
JTS 2 7/8", FLUSH PUMP W/ 15 BBLS, L/D ESP, TOP PUMP WAS
LOCK UP, 2ND & 3RD PUMP WERE HARD TO TURN, 4TH PUMP &
GAS SEP TURN FREE, POT HEAD, MOTOR LEAD & BTM 200' OF
CABLE WERE BURNT, SECURE WELL, SDFD

11/5/2014 6:30 7:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 46 P SAFETY MEETING,

7:00 8:45 1.75 PRDHEQ 38 P ASSEMBLE ESP, PREP FOR RIH
8:45 11:00 2.25 PRDHEQ 38 N KINKED CABLE, CUT AND SPLICE

11:00 16:45 5.75 PRDHEQ 38 P RIH W/ESP, CABLE AND CAP.

16:45 17:30 0.75 PRDHEQ 38 N DAMAGED CABLE WITH SLIPS, SPLICE. EOT: 6,650'

17:30 18:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 38 P SWFN

11/6/2014 6:30 7:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 46 P SAFETY MEETING

7:00 9:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 38 P RIH W/ ESP. PMPD 60 BBLS 2% KCL IN FLOWLINE FOR PREP

9:30 11:15 1.75 PRDHEQ 38 P SPLICE IN 2ND SPOOL

11:15 12:15 1.00 PRDHEQ 38 P RIH, NU CAPSTRING

12:15 13:30 1.25 PRDHEQ 38 P NUWH, PMPD 15 GAL. SCALE INHIBITOR

13:30 14:10 0.67 PRDHEQ 38 P RDMO, TURN TO PRODUCTION

January 26, 2015 at 11:37 am 3 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Feb. 12,
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