
Forrn OGC-la SUBMIT la ÆlPLICATE*

STATE OF UTAH (Other instructions on
reverse side)

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5. Lense Designation and Serial No.

Fee

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL, DEEPEN,OR PLUG BACK
6. If Indian. Allottee or Tribe Name

la. Type of Work 7. Unit Agreement Name

DRILL DEEPEN PLUG BACK
b. Tyne of Well

Oil Gas Single Multiple 8. Farm or Lease Name

Well Well Other Zone Zone

2. Nameof Operator
Evans

9. Well No.

Utex Oil Company
3. Address of Operator

2-19B3

1245 E. Bri ckyard Rd. , Suite 600 Sal t Lake 4(0 1 . Field and Pool, or Wildcat

i Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State require . P tagggt
At surface 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk.

1727 ' M 167 5 ' FEI" and Survey or Area

At proposed prod. zone pg¿. gt og svl JUN O5 Section 19, T2S, R3WUSM

14. Distance in miles and direction from neÙest town or post office* 12. County or Parrish 13. State

5 miles south of Altamont, Utah DIVISIGN Duchesne, Utah
15. Distance from proposed* 16. No.ÛÊe&ARNG 17. No. of acres assigned

location to nearest
to this well

property or lease line, ft 120
(Also to nearest drig. line, if any) p 640

18. Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed depth 20. Rotary or cable tools

to nearest well, drilling, completed,
or applied for, on this lease, ft. 12,4ÛÛ ROtary

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, RT. GR, etc.) 22. Approx, date work will start*

6020' GR July 1, 1985
23. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

Size of Hole Size of Casing Weight per Foot Setting Depth Quantity of Cement

12 1/4" 9 5/8" 36# 4,000 Circulate to Surface
8 3/4" 7" 26# 10,200 As necessary
6 1/8" 5" 18# 12,400 As necessary

Utex controls the land within 660' of the well location. CONFIDENTIAl.
APPR vr HE STATE

OF H NON OFOf 'A N MINING

Water Permit # 43-96-53 is on file wit e
SSt eC

a .

IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM: If proposal is to deepen or plug back, give data on present productive zone and proposed new pro-

ductive zone. If proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give pertinent data on subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths. Give blowout

revSenter pro

............. Title..... .............. ..... .. Date .

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Permit No. .......... ....... . ........ Approval Date .

Approved by......... ........... ... ........ .. .......... Title...... ......... ........ Date
Conditions of approval, if any:

*See Instructions On Reverse
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UTEX O/L C;0MPANY LOCATED - THE NE¾ OF THE SW¾ OF

WELL LOCAT/ON PLAT
SECTION 19, T2S, R3W, U.S.B.&M.

EVANS 2-/983

N TH

/9

SCALE:1"=l000'
EVA/VS 2-/983
GROUNO ELEV. 6020'

/727'

EAST 79./4 Chs.

LEGEND & HOTES SURVEYOR'S CERT/F/CATE

* ORIGINAL STONE CORNER FOUND AND USED i hereby certify that this plat was prepared
BY THIS SURVEY. from field notes of an actual survey

performed by me, during which the shown
monuments were found or established.

THE GENERAL LAND OFFICE PLAT WAS USED

FOR RFERENCE AND CALCULATIONS.

Jerfy D. AljrÁd,Registered Land
THE BASIS OF BEARINGS WAS DETERMINED BY geyor, Cert. No. 3817 (Utah)

SOLAR OBSERVATIONS .

JERRY D. ALLRED & ASSOCIATES
Surveying& Engineering Consultants

121 North Center Street
P.O. Drawer C

DUCHESNE, UTAH 84021
2 3 May ' 85 7 9-121-0 83 (801)
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UTEX OIL COMPANY

SUITE 600

1245 EAST BRICKYARD ROAD

SALT LAKE CITY,UTAH8410f

PHONE (801)484-2262

June 3, 1985

State of Utah
Department of Natural Resources REC VEDDivision of Oil, Gas and Mining
355 West North Temple
3 Triad Center, Suite 350 JLUM0 5 1985
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

DiVISION Ur DIL
GAS & MININGi

Gentlemen:

Enclosed please find the following:

1. Triplicate copies of Application for Permit to Drill
the Evans 2-19B3 well, located in the NE¼, SWh of Section
19, Township 2 South, Range 3 West, Duchesne County,
Utah.

2. Triplicate copies of survey plat.
3. Triplicate copies of well layout plat.
4. Triplicate copies of BOP drawing.
5. Triplicate copies of 10 Point Well Prognosis.

We trust this application is complete and in proper form
for your rapid approval of our planned operations. If further
information is required, please contact us at the above address
or telephone number.

We hereby request that this APD and all other information
submitted relative to this well be held confidential for the
maximum allowable period of time.

If I may be of further assistance, please advise.

Sincerely,

D. T. Hansen

DTH/mm
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May 2, 1985

UTEXOIL COMPANY
10 Point Well Prognosis

EVANS2-19B3

1. Surface formation: Tertiary Uinta Formation

2. Estimated tops of geologic markers: Top Green River 4,250
Top Wasatch 10,435

3. Estimated depths to water, oil and gas or mineral bearing formations:

0-4,250 Uinta - Water bearing
4,250-10,435 Green River - Oil, Gas and Water

10,435 to T.D. Wasatch - Oil, Gas and Water

4. Casing program: Size Weight Grade Depth

9 5/8" 36# J-55 4,000'
7" 26# N-80 10,200'
5" 18# N-80 12,400'

5. Pressure control equipment: See diagram attached to APD.
Blowout preventers: A series 1500, 5000 psi W.P.
hydraulically operated double ram type preventer, with pipe and blind
rams, and a 5000 psi, Hydril type preventer will be used.
A 5,000 psi W.P. hydraulic choke manifold, PVT, and flow sensors will
be used.
Testing Procedure: Before drilling out each casing string, blowout pre-
venters, casing head, and casing will be pressure tested, and blowout
preventers will be checked for proper operation each day.

6. Type and characteristics of proposed circulating medium:
0-4,000 Fresh water with gel sweeps
4,000-10,200 Fresh gel mud lightly treated, water loss controlled

below 7,000'.
10,200-T.D. Fresh gel mud, weighted, treated and dispersed as

necessary.
Approximately 800 barrels of circulating fluid and
adequate bulk barite will be maintained on site.

7. Auxillary Equipment:
Upper and lower kelly cocks will be used, and a full opening valve will
be maintained on the rig floor. A mud logging unit is planned from
7,000' to total depth with 24 hour supervision.

8. Testing and Coring:
No DST's are planned
DIL with S.P. and G.R., FD-CN

9. Anticipated Hazards:
No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No hydrogen
sulfide is present in this area.

10. Anticipated starting date:
duly 1, 1985 with duration of operations approximately 90
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DESCRIPTION OF RIGHT-OF-WAY IN S¾ OF SW¾, SECTION 19

A 33 feet wide right-of-way over part of Section 19, Township 2 South,

Range 3 West of the Uintah Special Base and Meridian, the centerline of

said right-of-way being further described as follows:

Beginning at a point on the West line of said S¾, said point being North

430.57 feet from the Southwest Corner of said Section 19;

Thence North 78°37'23" East 252.07 feet;

Thence North 71° 38'01" East 232.54 feet;

Thence North 89°42'39" East 345.59 feet;

Thence South 79°56'll" East 269.85 feet;

Thence North 87°17'21" East 269.82 feet;

Thence North 2l°21'25" East 133.05 feet;

Thence North 3°06'22" West 380.62 feet;

Thence North 7°49'39" East 215.46 feet;

Thence North 7°50'43" East 82 feet, more or less to the North line of said

S¾, containing 1.65
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R/GH T-OE-WAY AND USE BOUNDARY
EVANS 2-/983 RECEIVED

U TEX 0/L C0&fPANY JUN0 5 1985

DIVISION OF OiL
GAS & MINING

USE BOUNDARY DESCRIPTION

Beginning at a point which is North 45°02'32" East 2087.72 feet from the
Southwest Corner of Section 19, Township 2 South, Range 3 West of the
Uintah Special Base and Meridian;

Thence North 400 feet;

Thence East 570 feet;

Thence South 400 feet;

Thence West 570 feet to the Point of Beginning, containing 5.23 acres.

DESCRTPTION OF RIGHT-OF-WAY IN SECTIONS 24 & 25

A 33 feet wide right-of-way over part of Sections 24 and 25, Township 2 South,
Range 4 West of the Uintah Special Base and Meridian, the centerline of said
right-of-way being further described as follows:
Beginning at a point on the East line of said Section 24., said point being
North 430.57 feet from the Southwest Corner of Section 19, Township 2 South,
Range 3 West;

Thence South 78°37'23" West 121.47 feet;
Thence South 8734'20" West 223 feet;

Thence South 20°52'52" West 216.32 feet;

Thence South 27°15'26" West 279.88 feet;

Thence South 63°13'25" West 218.87 feet;

Thence South 57°51'03" West 318.37 feet;
Thence South 52·22'30" West 492.98 feet;

Thence South 60°56'30" West 252.30 feet to an existinÿoil well location,
containing l.6l acres.
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Thence South 60°56'30" West 252.30 feet to an existinÿoil well location,

containing l.61 acres.

DESCRIPTION OF RIGHT-OF-WAY IN NE¾ OF SW¾, SECTION 19

A 33 feet wide right-of-way over part of Section 19, Township 2 South,

Range 3 West of the Uintah Special Base and Meridian, the centerline of

said right-of-way being further described as follows:

Beginning at a point which is North 45°02'32" East 2087.72 feet from the

Southwest Corner of said Section 19;
'

Thence South 36°46'06" West 79.69 feet;

Thence South 7°50'43" West 92 feet, more or less to the South line of said

NE¾ of said SW¾, containing 0.13 acres.

JERRY D. ALLRED & ASSOCIATES
Surveying & Engineering Consultanto

121 North Center Street
P O. Drawer C

DUCHESNE, UTAH 84021
v' SS 79- /2/- O£3 (801)
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OPERATOR Áf-( / Ñ41 frv DATE -6-Sg
WELLNAME 2 - 19 63
SEC Nei á \p T 25 R 3h/ COUNTY Q at j a tÆ >
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STATEOF UTAH Norman H. Bangerter. GovernorNATURALRESOURCES Dee C. Hansen, Executive Director
Oil, Gas & Mining Dianne R. Nielson, Ph.D., Division Director

355 W. North Temple • 3 Triad Center - Suite 350 • Salt Lake City, UT84180-1203 •801-538-5340

3une 24, 1985 -

Utex Oil Company
1245 E. Brickyard Road, Suite 600
Salt Lake City, Utah 84106

Gentlemen:

Re: Well No. Evans 2-19B3 - NE SW Sec. 19, T. 2S, R. 3W
1675' FSL, 1727' FWL - Duchesne County, Utah

Approval to drill the above-referenced oil well is hereby granted in
accordance with the Order of Cause No. 139-42 dated April 17, 1985.

In addition, the following actions are necessary to fully comply withthis approval:

1. Spudding notification to the Division within 24 hours after drillingoperations commence.

2. Submittal to the Division of completed Form OGC-8-X, Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling.

3. Prompt notification to the Division should you determine that it is
necessary to plug and abandon this well. Notify 3ohn R. Baza,
Petroleum Engineer, (Office) (801) 538-5340, (Home) 298-7695, or
R. J. Firth, Associate Director, (Home) 571-6068.

4. Compliance with the requirements and regulations of Rule C-27,
Associated Gas Flaring, General Rules and Regulations, Oil and Gas
Conservation.

an equal opportunity
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Page 2
Utex Oil Company
Well No. Evans 2-1983
June 24, 1985

5. This approval shall expire one (1) year after date of issuance unless
substantial and continuous operation is underway or an application
for an extension is made prior to the approval expiration date.

The API number assigned to this well is 43-Ol3-3lil3.

R. 3. i th
Associate Director, Oil & Gas

as
Enclosures
cc: Branch of Fluid
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43-96-53

DIVISIONOFOIL,GASANDMINING

SPUDDINGINPORiATIONAPI 43-013-31113

NAFEOFCITTANY:UTEX OIL COMPANY

WFilNAMF: EVANS 2-19-B3

SECTIONNE SW 19 TOWNSHIP 2S RANGE 3W COUNTY Duchesne

DRILLINGCONTRACTOR
RIG#
SPUDDED:DATE 6-79-85

TIME s·nn Av

BOW nvy Hola Spudder

DRILLINGWILL COMMENCEUtex Drilling - Rig #48

REPORTEDBY Connie

TELEPHONEg 738-5798

DATE
.

6-28-85 SIGNED
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SPUDDINGINPORiATIONAPI 43-013-31113

NAFEOFCITTANY:UTEX OIL COMPANY
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DRILLINGCONTRACTOR
RIG#
SPUDDED:DATE 6-79-85
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REPORTEDBY Connie

TELEPHONEg 738-5798

DATE
.

6-28-85 SIGNED



' "ITED STATES
DEPA . -NT OF THE INTERIOR as

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY 14-20-H62-1734

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL, DEEPEN, OR PLUG 3AC<
Ute Tribe

1a. TTPE OF WORK

DRILL Ð DEEPENO PLUG BAG 7. ULT A(H'EMENT NAMD

kb. TYPE OF WELL

W LL
VAFLL

OTHER
NGLE 3fONLTIPLE 6. FA E NAME

2. NAME OF OPERATOR Evans

Utex Oil Company Û. WELL NO.

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 2-19B3
1245 E. Brickyard Rd., Suite 600, Salt Lake City, UT 84106 10. FIELD AND POOL, OE WILDCAT

* x°rcarrr°a"ŒOF WELL (Report location clearly and In accordance with any State requirements.*) Altamont

1727' FWL 1675' FSL 11. SEC., T., R., Ù., OR BLK.
AND SURVEY OR AREA

At proposed prod. zone
Sec. 19-T2S-R3W, USM

14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE* 12. COUNTY OR PARISH 13. STATE

5 miles South of Altamont, Utah Duchesne Utah
1 . DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED* 1Û. NO. OF ACEES IN LEASE 17. NO. OF ACRES ASSIGNED

LOCATION TO NEAREST TO THIS WELL
PROPERTT OR LEASE LINE, FT.
(Also to nearest drlg. unit line, if any)

18. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED LOCATION* 1Û. PROPOSED DEPTH 20. ROTARY OR CABLi OOLS
TO NEAREST WELL, DRILLING, COMPLETED,

OR APPLIED FOR, ON THIS LEASE, Fr. 12,400 Rotary
21. ELEVATIONs (Show whether DF, RT, GR. etc.) 22. APPROI. DATE WORK WILL START*

6020' GR July 9, 1985
23. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

SIZE OF HOLE SIZE OF CASING WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTII QUANTITY OF CEMENT

12-1/4" 9-5/8" 36# 4,000 Circulate to Surface
8-3/4" 7" 26# 10,200 As necessary
6-1/8" 5" 18# 12,400 As necessary

Utex controls the land within 660' of the well location.

* Subject to Communitization Agreement dated January 22, 1973
Water permit #43-96-53 is on file with the State of Utah.

IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM : If proposal is to deepen or plug back, give data on present productive zone ind proposod new productive
zone. If proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give pertinent data on subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths. Give blowout

SIGN D TITLE Executive Secretary DATE July 25, 1985

bis space for Federal or State office use)

APPRMOVENDO

TITLE

A V D E

DATE
CONDITIONS O PPROVAL, IF ANY :

COWSmeMSOFAFFROVALATTACHES *See Instructions On ReverseSide
TOCPEMPFSCOPY

NOTICE OF APPROVAL
LLT-CRO-6-M-
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CONDITIONSOF APPROVALFOR NOTICETO DRILL

. Company Utex Oil Company Well. No. Evans 2-19B3

Location Section 19 T 2S R 3W Lease No. 14-20-H62-1734

Onsite Inspection Date BLM- Waived

A. DRILLING PROGRAM

1. Daily drilling and completion progress reports shall be submitted
to this office on a weekly basis.

2. Cementing programs for the intermediate string and the production string
will protect any hydrocarbon zones encountered while drilling.

3. B0P's will be pressure tested after setting the intermediate string.
Ram-preventers shall be tested to a minimum of 5000 psi. The Annular-
preventer shall be tested to a minimum of 2500 psi. Notify this office
a minimum of 4 hours prior to testing.

4. Choke manifold shall conform with API RP 53.

5. Submit three copies of Designation of Operator as soon as possible.

6. Submit to this office the anticipated bottom hole pressure as soon as possible.

B. THIRTEENPOINT SURFACEUSE PLAN

1. Tank batteries will be placed on the south side of the location between points
4 and 2.

2. Construction material will be located on lease.

3. All trash must be contained and disposed of by a trash cage and hauled to
an approved sanitary landfill.

4. Produced waste water will be confined to tanks for a period n,ot to exceed
90 days after initial production. During the 90 day period an application for
approval of a permanent disposal method and location, älong with reauired water
analysis, will be submitted for the A0's approval. Failure to file an application
within the time allowed will be considered an incident of noncompliance, and
will be grounds for issuing a shut-in order.

5. Well Site Layout: The reserve pit will be located on the west side of the
location between points 4 and 6.

6. The stockpiled topsoil will be stored on the northwest corner near point #6.

7. Access to the well pad will be from the southeast corner near point 2.

8. The reserve pit and that portion of the location and access road not
needed for production or production facilities will be reclaimed within 90
days of well
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TATE OF UTAH 30wr in irurnon, on
res cre air iDEPARTD.acN f OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 6· "^" =*'°"'22°" "' •=** '
Fee

Ô. 17 INDIAN, A1.LOTTEM OE TAISE .Nd
SUNDRYNOTIŒ5 AND REPORTS ON WELLS(Do not use this form for procoaals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reserYoir.

Use ''APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-- for suen propossaaJ1.

7. un17 aoar=Mant nawaI.L
WASLL

OTHEE
2. .saus or orrutos

a. raan on s.zaa= nausUTEXOIL COMPANY
EVANS3. Anozzaa or orzaarca

9. wzzz.So.Suite 600, 1245 East Brickyard Road, Salt Lake City, Utah 84106 2-19834. Loc1TIon or wtLL (Report location clearly and in accoraance wtta any State requirementa.• 10. r1=Lo ano root., on wit.oca:

See also soace 17 below.)
: suena

Altamont
11. arc- 7.. 1. X.. ox ILI. xxo

1,727' FWL 1,675' FSL
.ex =r on 22.x

Section 19, T2S, R3'.4,USM14. PranzT 30. 15. XLavATIONa (Show weather Dr. 17. GA, «ta.) 12 Coc.NTY on raxisu 1.3. arata43-013-31113 6,020' GR Duchesne Utah26- Check Appropnote Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Deto'to·:Icz or 1NTINTION TO:
acauxquzxT tzroxT or:TIET WITEE BECT-QYT PULL DE ALITIt CASING

WATIE 3HUT-OFF
RETAInlNG WELLFRACTUILE TREAT

MCLTIPLE COMPLYTE
TRACTtiRE TEEATMENT ALTERING ClalNGSHOOT OR ACIDI2E ABANDON*
SHOUTINC OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*arrua wet.t.

CHANGE PUNE
(Othrr) DRILLING(Othe

(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well

r)

('outpietion or Rrcompletton Report and Ler form.)
17. DEsenist runenszo on cuarLETED UPERATroNs (Clearly state all pertínent details. and give pertinent dates. Including estimated date of starting an

proposed work. If well is dirretionally drilled. gave subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pert:

S D L AT 9:30 A.M. ON JULY 9, 1985

July 9, 1985 through July 16, 1985
Drilled from 0 to 4,875' in the Uintah formation

, iRan 96 joints of 9 5/8" J-55 36# casing, cemented '
9

8ÿJuly 17, 1985 through July 23, 1985 topDrilled from 4,875' to 7,361' in the Green River formatio'ridS4 u,

Julv24, 1985through Julv 30, 1985
Drilled from 7,361' to 8,003' in the Green River formation
July 31, 1985 through August 6, 1985
Drilled from 8,003' to 9,110' in the Green River formation
August 7, 1985 through August 13, 1985Drilled from 9,110' to 10,200' in the Green River formationLogged

CONFilENR
Page 1

e ,co set

Secretary
ex-2 8-13-85

a space for Federal o State acce use)

AP""ovED BY
TITLE

DATE
Co..uu.. 3 OF AFPROVIL. 17
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F r:n UGC-lb
it int!T IN luirl.lt 30.° '

'TATE OF UTAH Othrr ustraroon, on
revere ,uir pDEPARTMaf OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 'rasa om.somarron suo .=.rac ,

Fee
6. tr luotan, ALLortza on talas saSUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTSON WELLS(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.Use "APPI..ICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such propossia.)1.

1. unit ausszusar Namaw I.I. wzt.L O o2-
2. Maxa or orrazzos

8. rian om Laass nausUTEXOIL COMPANY
EVANS3. Anozzas or orstarox

9. war.z. No.Suite 600, 1245 East Brickyard Road, Salt Lake City, Utah 84106 2-19834. Loc1TION or «EI.T. (Report location clearly and in accordance with any StAte requirementa,• 10. rtzLD aun rooL, on wlLDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
t.neac•

Altamont
11. asc.. T., 1- x.. on st.x. xxo

1,727' FWL 1,675' FSL
.ou.x on 2.4

Section 19, T2S, R3¼,USM14. rzantzT 30. 15. ELXvATIONa (Show whether Dr. RT. an, etc.) 12. coDNTT os razzas 13. s:Aza43-013-31113 6,020' GR Duchesne Utahis- Check Appropnate BoxTo indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data:Tor:Ca or INTzNTION To:
scanzql:zxT IzrozT or:

TI3T WATZE BBCT-OFT POLL OR ALTITL CasrNG wATER 3HUT-Org
REPAIRING WEE.E.FRACTUEE TREAT MCLTIPLE COMPt.¾TE

FRACTURE TEEATMENT ALTERINC CASINGSHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON*
3HOUTING Ort ACIDlzlNO ABANDONMEltt*ItcrAIR WET.L

citANGE PI.ANN
(Othrr) .. DRILLING

(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well
(Other)

Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)
17. DEscarnE rÑ>POSEn on Co.wrt.£TED UPERATIONs (Cle::rly state nil pertinent detalis, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting an;

proposed work. If well is di.netionally drilled. give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perts

nent to this work.) •

August 14, 1985 through August 20, 1985Drilled from 10,200' to 10,690' in the Wasatch formationRan 249 joints of 7" 26# casing, cemented.
August 21, 1985 through August 27, 1985Drilled from 10,690' to 11,642' in the Wasatch formation
August 28, 1985 through September 6, 1985Drilled from 11,642' to 12,400' in the Wasatch formation AECElVEDT.D. 12,400' on 9-3-85
Logged
Ran 59 joints of 5" 18# casing. SEP24 gRIG RELEASED AT 2:00 A.M. on September 6, 1985

IVidiON OF OftGAS&MINING

DENTIAL
Page 2sere e at t ror a correct

TIT Secretary 9-17-85
This space for FederÅ or S*ate once use)
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scanzql:zxT IzrozT or:

TI3T WATZE BBCT-OFT POLL OR ALTITL CasrNG wATER 3HUT-Org
REPAIRING WEE.E.FRACTUEE TREAT MCLTIPLE COMPt.¾TE

FRACTURE TEEATMENT ALTERINC CASINGSHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON*
3HOUTING Ort ACIDlzlNO ABANDONMEltt*ItcrAIR WET.L

citANGE PI.ANN
(Othrr) .. DRILLING

(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well
(Other)

Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)
17. DEscarnE rÑ>POSEn on Co.wrt.£TED UPERATIONs (Cle::rly state nil pertinent detalis, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting an;

proposed work. If well is di.netionally drilled. give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perts

nent to this work.) •

August 14, 1985 through August 20, 1985Drilled from 10,200' to 10,690' in the Wasatch formationRan 249 joints of 7" 26# casing, cemented.
August 21, 1985 through August 27, 1985Drilled from 10,690' to 11,642' in the Wasatch formation
August 28, 1985 through September 6, 1985Drilled from 11,642' to 12,400' in the Wasatch formation AECElVEDT.D. 12,400' on 9-3-85
Logged
Ran 59 joints of 5" 18# casing. SEP24 gRIG RELEASED AT 2:00 A.M. on September 6, 1985

IVidiON OF OftGAS&MINING

DENTIAL
Page 2sere e at t ror a correct

TIT Secretary 9-17-85
This space for FederÅ or S*ate once use)

APT"m'ED BT _ __ TITLE
DATE
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Form UGC-3
SLB\i:T IN Di i ! E*

56 64 01
STATE OF -.AH (Sceotherinstra, a

on reverse side)DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND BERIAL NO.

6. Er

INFoi
ALLOTTES OB TRIBE NAME

la. TYPE OF WELL.
L DET Other 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF COMPLETION: T 2 8 1985 N/A
L 0 ER

EP TV.a.
Other S. - 05 mas M

2. NAME OF OPERATon Evans
DIVioluis OF OILUTEX OIL COMPANY 9. WE • NO.

3. Annazas or orzaAtos 2-1983
1245 E. Brickyard Rd., Ste. 600, Salt Lake City, Utah 84106 10. FIELD AND POOL, 05 WILDCAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance softh any State requirements)* AltamOntAt surface
1, 727 ' FWL, 1, 675 ' FSL 11. C , T R., 1(., OR ELOCK AND BCETET

At top prod. Interval reported below

At total depth Sec. 19, T2S, R3W, USM

14. PEKMIT No. cars issuso 12. couNTY om 13. sTITE

43-013-31113 6/24/85 Duc esne Utah
15. DATE SPCDDED ' 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 1Î. DATE coMPL. (Ready to prod.) 18. ELEVArroNa (Dr, ama, RT, GE, ETC.). 19. ELET. CAstNanzan

7/9/85 9/2/85 9/25/85 6,020' GR 6,020'
20. T&rAL DEFTH, MD A TVD 21. PLUC, BACA T.D.. MD A TVD 22. IF .\ffLTIPLE COMPL., 23. INTERVALS BOTART TOOLS CABLE TOOLS

HOW MANT* DEILLED BT12, 401' 12, 395 ' I O-TD I N/A
24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION---TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND Typ)• 25. wAs orarcTroNT

SURVET MADEOMQDO!TMi10,934' - 12,338' Wasatch No
26. TTPE ELECTRIC AND OTHEE LOGS RUN 27. WAs WELL CORED

DiL, F CN No
28. CASING RECORD (Report all strings set in seell)

CASING SIZE WEIGHT, LB./FT DEPTH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECOED AMOUNT PULLED

9-5/8" # 1 12¾" 1,298 sx None
7" 26# 10,200' 8-3/4" 735 sx

29. LINER RECORD 30. TUBING RECORD
SIZE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) BACKS CEMENT SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPTE BET (MD) PACggg SET (MD)

5" 995' l 1 260 2-7/8 10,053' 10,053'
2-3/8" 6,7½' Heat StrinqŠl. PsaronATron arcoan (Interval, an. and number) 32. ACID, SHOT. FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTR INTERVAL (MD) A3t0UNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL USED
See attached list· 10,934'-12,338' Natural

3 shots/ft. 369 holes

33.•
PRODUCTION

DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD (Floto ag, gge Ef‡, pumping-eia@ GRd igpe Of pump) WELL STATua (Producing or
shut-in)9 25/85 i Flowing ProducingDATE OF TE5T HOtas TESTED CHOKE BIZE PROD N. FOR DIL-BÓL. GAS-MCF. WATER-·-BEL. GAS-OIL RATIO

9/29/85 | 72 \ 14/64 1,918 1,213 140 0.63:1
PIDW. TURING FRama. CAslNo PRESSURE CALCULA7ED DIL---anL. GAS--MCP. WATUR---BBL. OIL GRATITT-API (CORE.)24-HO R EATE

1, 300 -0-
- 639 404 46 43°

34. DISPOmiTION OF GAS (ÑOld, udCd for fktl, PfWifd, ElC.)
TEST WITNESSED ST

Sold Don Baucum
35. LIST 07 ATTACEMENTS

Perforation List
30. I hereby certitý that the to egcir; and attached informattors is complete and correct as determined fretu all available recorde

SIGNED TITLE DATE

*(S., Instructionsord Snocesfor Additional Data on Reverse
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RECEivED
PERFORATIONS (MOT26 1806

EVANS 2-19B3
DIVISION OF 0;

Depths from DIL Dated 9/3/85 GAS & WHNING

10,934-36 11,410-12 11,832-34

10,946-48 11,431-33 11,859-60

10,981-83 11,440-42 11,866-67

11,001-03 11,457-59 11,889-90

11,044-46 11,481-82 11,910-12

11,058-59 11,501-03 11,927-28

11,065-67 11,530-31 11,941-42

11,078-79 11,548-50 11,963-64

11,092-94 11,573-74 12,012-13

11,109-11 11,580-82 12,025-26

11,130-32 11,588-90 12,045-46

11,150-52 11,600-02 12,062-64

11,167-68 11,613-14 12,069-71

11,186-88 11,628-30 12,085-87

11,200-02 11,641-43 12,095-96

11,255-56 11,651-52 12,149-51

11,285-87 11,668-70 12,226-28

11,292-94 11,681-83 12,253-56

11,305-07 11,686-87 12,275-77

11,324-26 11,692-94 12,292-94

11,332-33 11,717-19 12,301-03

11,341-42 11,727-28 12,309-10

11,355-56 11,745-47 12,321-23

11,377-79 11,759-61 12,337-38

11,396-98 11,808-10

123' Net
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UTEX OIL COMPANY

SUITE 600
1245 EAST BRICKYARD ROAD
SALT LAKE CITY,UTAHB4106

PHONE (801) 4-2262

RECEIVED
OCT25 1985

DATE
OCT28 1985

OlvlSiON OF OIL
STATE OF UTAH

GAS & MINING
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS & MINING
355 West North Temple
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

RE: WELL Eupas ¿-/9/33
API # -/ j'f/)

Gentlemen:

Enclosed please find the Completion Report and Perforation Record
for the above referenced well, in duplicate.

Please note that all information submitted to you is to be held
"CONFIDENTIAL" for the maximum allowable period of time, which is
seven (7) months from the date of submittal.

Thank you for your cooperation. If you have any questions, or if
you need any further information, please contact this office.

Sincerely,

Jennifer S. Winterroth

/jsw

Enclosures

PLEASE SIGN THE COPY OF THIS LETTER IN THE SPACE PROVIDED BELOW AND
RETURN TO UTEX FOR OUR RECORDS.

Receipt o£ the above information is hereby acknowledged, ,this

UTEX OIL COMPANY

SUITE 600
1245 EAST BRICKYARD ROAD
SALT LAKE CITY,UTAHB4106

PHONE (801) 4-2262

RECEIVED
OCT25 1985

DATE

OCT28 1985

OlvlSiON OF OIL
STATE OF UTAH

GAS & MINING
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS & MINING
355 West North Temple
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

RE: WELL Eupas ¿-/9/33
API # -/ j'f/)

Gentlemen:

Enclosed please find the Completion Report and Perforation Record
for the above referenced well, in duplicate.

Please note that all information submitted to you is to be held
"CONFIDENTIAL" for the maximum allowable period of time, which is
seven (7) months from the date of submittal.

Thank you for your cooperation. If you have any questions, or if
you need any further information, please contact this office.

Sincerely,

Jennifer S. Winterroth

/jsw

Enclosures

PLEASE SIGN THE COPY OF THIS LETTER IN THE SPACE PROVIDED BELOW AND
RETURN TO UTEX FOR OUR RECORDS.

Receipt o£ the above information is hereby acknowledged, ,this



Cil & Gas Company

P.O. Box X, Vernal, Utah 84078, Telephone (801) 789-0790

:

DEC091986
December 8 , 1986

DIVISlUNOFOIL GAS &MINING

Utah Natural Resources
Oil, Gas & Mining
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Ut 84180-1203

Dear Sir,

We have assumed operation of the following wells from Utex Oil Co.

December 1, 1986.

Jo 7gg' Lamico 2-5B2 JA.Jei.

fggy 7 Reese Estate 2-10B2 y'Já
jp7&g~ Hall 1-24B2 de /

y ta y Rust 3-4B3 '(76
J///3 Evans 2-19BS /7 (f
3djy Tew 2-10B ggg

gy ýý Burton 2-15B5 /
JMy,g Ute 2-22B5 ±" ~3-

Jdf/7 . Hanskutt 2-23B5.
- .ALÁ Afúd2d

y py g Potter 2-24B$ fs g, 4/73/

p g¿, Broadhead 2-32B5
,/4 go y µ¿

Smith 1-14C5
,,yx & /4/ ZJA

I understand we initially need to report these on your N

Entity Action" form. Would you please send some of these forms for
reporting these wells next month. Would you also advise me which action
code to use. Thank you for your help in advance.

Carol Hatch
Production Clerk

Part of the Enron Group of Energy

Cil & Gas Company

P.O. Box X, Vernal, Utah 84078, Telephone (801) 789-0790

:

DEC091986
December 8 , 1986

DIVISlUNOF
OIL GAS &MINING

Utah Natural Resources
Oil, Gas & Mining
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Ut 84180-1203

Dear Sir,

We have assumed operation of the following wells from Utex Oil Co.

December 1, 1986.
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Entity Action" form. Would you please send some of these forms for
reporting these wells next month. Would you also advise me which action
code to use. Thank you for your help in advance.

Carol Hatch
Production Clerk

Part of the Enron Group of Energy



Form OGC-lb SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE*
-TE OF UTAH (Oth- ti on

DEPARTMEN. JF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING . I.BASE DESIONATEDN AWS OBRIAL 80.

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
. IF INDIAN, ALIAþTTBB 08 TalBB NAME

(Do not ase this form for pronosals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a difereat reservoir.
Use "APPIACATION FOR PERMIT-" ter soeb proposals.)

. UNIT AOBBBMSMT NAME
OIL OAS
WELL WELL OTHER

. MANE OF OPERATom 8. PABM 08 LSABB NAME

Enron O & Gas Co. Evans
A. Annaass or orsaasos e. wm.L NO.

P. O. Box 1815, Verna , Utah 80078 -1983

4. LOCATION OF WELL (ËtpOrt ÎOtatiOD titarly EDAin 8000TÈRDet With ämy tate regUtremeStS, FIELD AND POOL, 08 WN.DCAT
See also space 17 below.)
At eartaes Altament

11. asc.. T., a.. x, 05 BLE. Axe

1,727 FWL, 1,675 FSL SecŸ"SfŠl, 83W

14. PaaMIT Wo. 15. saavArrows (Show whether er, ar, en, eta.) 18. cousrr os Pastas là. ersta
43-013-3 113 6,020 GR Duchesne Lïtah

te CitecicAppropriate BoxTo indicate Natureof Notice,Report,or OtlierData
morren or sarantrom wo: sossaevaar aaroar or:

TEST WATSB BRUT•OFF POLL OR ALTER CASING WATER BRUT-Orr REPAIRING WELL

PRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT 05 ACIDIzE ABANDON* BROOTINC OR ACIDIEINO ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHAWGE PLANs (Other)
(Nors: Report results of multiple completion en Wel(Other) ('umpletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DEBCRIBE PROPOSED OR CUMPLETED DPERATIONs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and sones perti-
nent to this Work.) •

ENRON OLS GAS CO. ( orrer e co De e opment, Be north Pet. or HNG O Co. )

has accumed operation o hs ease ei ective December 1, 986 rom Ue Co.

18. I hpreby eer t the t regoing is true and correct

BIGNE TITLE District Super ntendent pays 12-8-86

(This space for Federal or State omce nee)

APPROVED BT TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse
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SX OIL & GAS CORPORATION
C As 2HoustonCenter,Suite2000

909Fannm •P.O BoxÄ326
OO Houston. Texas 77210-4326

(713) 739-3000

January 20 1988 -

State of Utah ),Department of Natural Resources
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining AN26 1988Suite 350, 3 Triad Center
355 West North Temple
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203 Dfv610NOF

CiL,ßAS&WING

Gentlemen:

Effective August 1, 1987, CSX Oil & Gas Corporation purchased Enron Oil & Gas
Company's interest in several wells located in the State of Utah. (See
attached list). Actual operation of these wells by CSX Oil & Gas Corpora-
tion began on November 1, 1987.

As the new operator of wells located in the State of Utah, GSX Oil & Gas
Corporation herewith submits Form DOGM-2(Blanket Bond in the amount of
$80,000.00) to cover CSX Oil & Gas Corporation's oil and gas activities
within the State of Utah. Please advise if other bonds or information is
required by your office and/or the Utah Division of State Lands & Forestry.

For your information, CSX Oil & Gas Corporation has an approved Collective
Bond ($75,000) on file with the Bureau of Indian Affairs.

Should you require additional documents or have questions conerning the
enclosed bond, please call Mr. Gary Birdwell at (713) 739-3000. Thank you.

Sincerely yours,

S CORP

Patricia A. Rygg
Consulting Regulatory Agent

PAR/me
Enclosures

xc: CSX Oil & Gas Corporation
410 Seventeenth St., Suite 300
Denver, Colorado 80202
ATTN: Mr. Gene

SX OIL & GAS CORPORATION
C As 2HoustonCenter,Suite2000

909Fannm •P.O BoxÄ326
OO Houston. Texas 77210-4326

(713) 739-3000

January 20 1988 -

State of Utah ),Department of Natural Resources
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Operator: CSX Oil & Gas Corporation
County: Duchesne
State: Utah

UNIT/WELLhKL_ FIELD LEASE
Broadhead 2-32B5 Altamont Fee ~

Burton 2-1585 Altamont Indian/Fee (CA 96-46) g_;¡s-3/t
Duncan 2-985 Altamont Fee // / - 2/ÿ ; 5 ¿
Evans 2-19B3 Altamont Indian/Fee (CA 96-78) f3 c/3 3///3 253 /7
Hall $-2482 P&A'd August, 1987 Indian/State/Fee 43-0/ D

(CA UTO80I-85C75) p ,

Hanskutt 2-2385 Altamont Fee '/3-0i3-3 /¯2 ys t ¿Sc
Lamicque 2-5B2 Bluebell Indian/Fee (CA 96-83) 3 /3-3
Potter 2-2485 Altamont Fee V3 / 5 //I S
Reese Estate 2-10B2 Bluebell Fee V3-/
Rust 3-483

Altamont/Bluebell Fee Ÿ34/3-3/c : 3 r /9Smith 1-14CS Altamont Indian/Fee (CA UT-080I49-87C6 )
~c/3 3c

Tew 2-1085 Altamont Indian/Fee (CA 96-54) //3
-07 p 6 2

Ute 2-2285
Altamont/Bluebell Indian (Lease #14-20-H62-2509)f3 /

Ute Tribal 2-34A4
Altamont/Bluebell Indian/State/Fee (CA 96-40) i &

(Lease No. 14-20-H62-1774) VI-ris-ser/72

Note: CA - Applicable Communitization Agreement

Operator: CSX Oil & Gas Corporation
County: Duchesne
State: Utah

UNIT/WELLhKL_ FIELD LEASE
Broadhead 2-32B5 Altamont Fee ~
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Note: CA - Applicable Communitization Agreement



ENRON 110917
Oil & Gas Company

P.O. Box 1815 Vernal, UT .84078 (801) 789-0790

November 2, 1987

Utah Natural Resource
Oil, Gas & Mining

355 West North Temple
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Ut 84180-1203

Dear Sirs ,

This is to notify you that effective November 1, 1987 Enron's interest was
purchased by CSX Oil & Gas Corporation, 410 Seventeenth St., Suite 300, Denver,
Colorado 80202 in the wells listed below. Actual operation of said wells by CSX
began November 1, 1987.

o/ß--5/d3 BROADHEAD 2-32B5 25 50 Sed 39
4/3-3/01/ BURTON 2-15BS $5 50 Rd - Ì6

S-D/3-So7/¶ DUNCAN 2-9B5 45 VA) Er . Ÿj§- 9 ///3 EVANS 2-19B3 SS 3, ) C.
A J3· 013 30793 HALL ‡-24B2 ( þ 2 d SM.

oCJ S -0 /3-30837 REESE ESTATE 2-ÏÖ 5 ,2 ed /O

Enron will be reporting production and disposition for the renth of
September. These wells will be eliminated from Enron's produciton and disposition
report for October. If you have any questions please contact CSX at 303-825-8344.

Sincerely,

Carol Hatch
Production Analyst

cc: D. Wright
CSX

NOV 4 1987
Part of the Enron Group of Energy

ENRON 110917
Oil & Gas Company

P.O. Box 1815 Vernal, UT .84078 (801) 789-0790
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Salt Lake City, Ut 84180-1203

Dear Sirs ,

This is to notify you that effective November 1, 1987 Enron's interest was
purchased by CSX Oil & Gas Corporation, 410 Seventeenth St., Suite 300, Denver,
Colorado 80202 in the wells listed below. Actual operation of said wells by CSX
began November 1, 1987.

o/ß--5/d3 BROADHEAD 2-32B5 25 50 Sed 39
4/3-3/01/ BURTON 2-15BS $5 50 Rd - Ì6

S-D/3-So7/¶ DUNCAN 2-9B5 45 VA) Er . Ÿj§- 9 ///3 EVANS 2-19B3 SS 3, ) C.
A J3· 013 30793 HALL ‡-24B2 ( þ 2 d SM.

oCJ S -0 /3-30837 REESE ESTATE 2-ÏÖ 5 ,2 ed /O

Enron will be reporting production and disposition for the renth of
September. These wells will be eliminated from Enron's produciton and disposition
report for October. If you have any questions please contact CSX at 303-825-8344.

Sincerely,

Carol Hatch
Production Analyst

cc: D. Wright
CSX

NOV 4 1987
Part of the Enron Group of Energy



L TotalMinatome Corporation
OILANDGAS

June 3, 1988
DRN RJF

JRB GUd

DTS SW
O!L,GAS& NiNG

Re: CSX Oil & Gas Corporation
(formerly Texas Gas
Exploration Corporation)
TOTAL MINATOME CORPCRATION
(formerly MinatomeU>-FILE Corporation) Merger

Gentlemen:

Please note that effective April 27, 1988 CSX Oil & Gas
Corporation ("CSX") merged into TOTAL MINATOME CORPORATION ("TMC");and TMC is the surviving entity.

Please note that TMC is now responsible for paymentspreviously handled by CSX.

Please forward all invoices for what was formerly CSX goodsand services only to the following address:

TOTAL MINATOME CORPORATION
2 Houston Center,.Suite 2000 ·

909 Fannin
P. O. Box 4326
Houston, Texas 77210-4326

If you are currently sending invoices of any kind to TMC,these should continue to be forwarded to the address you arepresently using.

Should you require any further assistance, please notifyEdward C. Huey, telephone number (713) 739-3150.

. Sincerely,

AL RATION

2 efre Lefort
Vice President, Finance
and Administration

PL/ECH/sj

2 Houston Center, Suite 2000 • P.O. Box 4326 • Houston, Texas 77210-4326
Telephone (713) 739-3000 • Telecopier (713) 739-3160 • Telex
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UUOM 00•ð4-.
an equal opportunity employ

U1AH
NATURALRESOURCE:
OH, Gas & Mining

355 West North Temple, 3 Triad Center, Suite 350, Salt Lake City, Ut84180-1203.O(801-538-5340)
pa

MONTHLY OIL AND GAS PRODUCTION REPORT

Operator name and address:

*CSX OIL & GAS CORP Utah Account No. NSO20
P 0 BOX 4326
HOUSTON TX 77010 4326 Report Period (Month/Year)

Amended Report

Well Name Producing Days Production Volume
API Number Entity Location Zone Oper Oil (BBL) Gas (MSCF) Water (BBL)

RU5T #3-483
4301331070 01576 025 o3W 4 WSTC
POTTER #2-2485
4301331118 01731 02S 05w 24 wsTC
TEW 2-1085
4301331125 01756 025 05w 10 wsTC
EVANS #2-19B3
4301331113 01777 025 03W 19 wsTC
LAMICQ2-582
4301330784 02302 02S 02W 5 WSTc
2-985
4301330719 02410 02S OSW 9 WSTC

SKUTT 2-23BS
4301330917 09600 02s o5W 23 WSTC
UTE 2-34A-A
4301330978 10070 ois 04W 34 wsTC
BURTON#2-1585
4301331044 10210 025 OSW 15 WSTc
BROADHEAD #2-3285
4301331036 10216 02S 05W 32 WSTC
UTE #2-2285
4301331122 10453 02S OSW 22 WSTC

TOTAL

Comments (attach separate sheet if necessary)

I have reviewed this report and certify the information to be accurate and complete. Date

Ãuthorized signature - Telephone

PLEASE COMPLETE FORMS IN BLACK

UUOM 00•ð4-.
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Forrn OGCC-1 be
ST A TE OF UT A H SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE•

(Other instructions on re-
verse side) 5. Laast DzalONATION AND BERIAL NO.

OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION
Fee

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE Og TRIBE Nik

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for auch proposata.)

1, Î, UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

OIL GAS
WELL WELL OTHER

2, NAME OF OPERATOA 6. FARM OL LEARE MAME

Total Minatome Corporation Evans
8. ADDREsa OF OPERATOR S WELL N .

P. O. Box 4326 Houston, Texas 77210-4326 #2-19B3
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Itepart location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.• 10. rlELD AND POOL, 05 WILDCAT

Bee also space 17 below.)
at surface Altamont

11. BBC., I., L., K., OR BLK. AND
BURVET 01 ABBA

1,727' FWL 1,675' FSL SEC 19-T2S-R3W

14. PanMIT NO. 16. BI.EVATIONE (ShoW whether DF, RT, OK, etc.) 12. COUNTY OE PARISH 18. STATE

43-013-31113 6,020 GR Duchesne Utah

is CheckAppropnote BoxTo indicate Nature of Notice, Report,or Other Data
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: BUBBBQUENT EMPORT 07:

TEST WATER BBUT•OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER.BHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT I MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CAslNG

BHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* BHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)

(Other)
(NoTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well

L--- ( onipletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DEscRIBE PR POSED Olt COMPLETED UPERATIONS (ÛleurÌy Sigle all perttnent äelaits, and glye pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting nny
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and rnessured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this work.) *

Please be advised that CSX Oil & Gas Corporation has merged with Total Minatome
Corporation effective April 27, 1988, with CSX's name being changed accordingly.

18. I hereb tit th correct

TITLE

or
Records varx ? M

(This space for Federal or State omce use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVIL, IF ANY :

*Seeinstructionson Reverse

Forrn OGCC-1 be
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(Other instructions on re-
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Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for auch proposata.)

1, Î, UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

OIL GAS
WELL WELL OTHER

2, NAME OF OPERATOA 6. FARM OL LEARE MAME

Total Minatome Corporation Evans
8. ADDREsa OF OPERATOR S WELL N .

P. O. Box 4326 Houston, Texas 77210-4326 #2-19B3

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Itepart location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.• 10. rlELD AND POOL, 05 WILDCAT
Bee also space 17 below.)
at surface Altamont

11. BBC., I., L., K., OR BLK. AND
BURVET 01 ABBA

1,727' FWL 1,675' FSL SEC 19-T2S-R3W

14. PanMIT NO. 16. BI.EVATIONE (ShoW whether DF, RT, OK, etc.) 12. COUNTY OE PARISH 18. STATE

43-013-31113 6,020 GR Duchesne Utah

is CheckAppropnote BoxTo indicate Nature of Notice, Report,or Other Data
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: BUBBBQUENT EMPORT 07:

TEST WATER BBUT•OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER.BHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT I MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CAslNG

BHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* BHOOTING OR ACIDIZING
ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)

(Other)
(NoTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well

L--- ( onipletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DEscRIBE PR POSED Olt COMPLETED UPERATIONS (ÛleurÌy Sigle all perttnent äelaits, and glye pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting nny
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and rnessured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this work.) *

Please be advised that CSX Oil & Gas Corporation has merged with Total Minatome
Corporation effective April 27, 1988, with CSX's name being changed accordingly.

18. I hereb tit th correct

TITLE

or
Records varx ? M

(This space for Federal or State omce use)
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*Seeinstructionson Reverse



Ï&TemiŠs., UNITED STATES aragrr ty rargreara· l È,ise
(i ormerly 0-33)> DEPARTMFNT OF THE INTERIOR Terme side)

on re
i LEass DEsic araos up .

BUREAL LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOfKES AND REPORTSON WELLS IF SWDIAW, ALLOTTEE OB TRiss ma

(De not use this foran for proposals to drill or to deepen or plus back to a different reservoir.Uar ''APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for sueb proposals.)

7 UNIT seassusar massOILLI WABLL
OTHER

2. Naus or orsmaTom 8 raam om Lsans ways
TOTAL MINATOME CORPORATION EVANS

3. ADDREBB OF OPERATOR S WELL WO.
2 Houston Center, Suite 2000, Houston, TX 77210 #2-1983

4. I.o iTaoN or MELL (Report location
cleaÌ)y¯ani

in acËordanc any BLtne remente 10 ÃÑD POOI M a 17See also space 17 below.)at surface
Alt amont /Bluebell

Tasc., 2., a.. m.. on sea. ano
80BTET OR AREA1727' FWL & 1675' FSL

Sec 19-T2S-R3W
14 PEnktfT No 16 ElÆVATIONs (Show whether er, RT. on. etc ) 12. COUNTT 05 PAstaa 18. Brarx43-013-311113

| 6020' GR Duchesne Utah
** Check Appropnote BoxTo indicote Nature of Notice, Repon, or OtherData

NOTICE OF JNTENTION TO:
BUBBEQUENT REPORT OF:

TEST WATER SECTAFF El I-I OR ALTER < 451NG WATER SHCTerr BEPAIRING WELL
FRACTt RE TREAT III i IPLE COt1Pi FTE FRACTI RE TREATMENT ALTERING CAalNC
NHOUT OB ACIDIZE ABANDON*

BBOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANF IOther)

«NOTE Report results of multiple completion on WelIOther)
Completion or Recocipletion Report and Log form.}17 of.s<nrar rnovosto on ro irerve:.orinAvion (Cle:nt state all pertinent details. and else pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting anyproposed work If well is direcuonaJf.y drilled, give subsurface locations and ruensured and true vertleal depths for all markers and gones pertinent to this work.) *

1. Move in service rig and pump.
, 2. Test 7" casing to 3,000 psig.

3. Pull 2-3/8" & 2-7/8" tubing.
4. Drill out 5" Baker FA-1 Packer @ 10,050' KB.
5. Clean out 5"-18# liner to PBTD of 11,750' KB.
6. Set bridge plug on wireline @ 11,620' with 2 sxs cmt on top.
7. Perforate additional Wasatch infill zones as per attachment.
8. Run packer and acidize Wasatch perforations with 25,000 gals. acid.9. Return well to production, install Kobe pump.

COPY

Ilereby certif that the foregoing is tr nd correct

SIGNED., . TITLE Manager Production Oper.
DATE 07/18/88

(Tbis space for Federal or State omee use)

APPROVED By TITLE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY :

Title 16 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willí y to make to any department oi agency o theUniteö States sny false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as any matter within its
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| 6020' GR Duchesne Utah
** Check Appropnote BoxTo indicote Nature of Notice, Repon, or OtherData

NOTICE OF JNTENTION TO:
BUBBEQUENT REPORT OF:

TEST WATER SECTAFF El I-I OR ALTER < 451NG WATER SHCTerr BEPAIRING WELL
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NHOUT OB ACIDIZE ABANDON*
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«NOTE Report results of multiple completion on WelIOther)
Completion or Recocipletion Report and Log form.}17 of.s<nrar rnovosto on ro irerve:.orinAvion (Cle:nt state all pertinent details. and else pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting anyproposed work If well is direcuonaJf.y drilled, give subsurface locations and ruensured and true vertleal depths for all markers and gones pertinent to this work.) *

1. Move in service rig and pump.
, 2. Test 7" casing to 3,000 psig.

3. Pull 2-3/8" & 2-7/8" tubing.
4. Drill out 5" Baker FA-1 Packer @ 10,050' KB.
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6. Set bridge plug on wireline @ 11,620' with 2 sxs cmt on top.
7. Perforate additional Wasatch infill zones as per attachment.
8. Run packer and acidize Wasatch perforations with 25,000 gals. acid.9. Return well to production, install Kobe pump.

COPY

Ilereby certif that the foregoing is tr nd correct

SIGNED., . TITLE Manager Production Oper.
DATE 07/18/88

(Tbis space for Federal or State omee use)

APPROVED By TITLE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY :

Title 16 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willí y to make to any department oi agency o theUniteö States sny false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as any matter within its



TOTAL MINATOME CORPORATION
EVANS No. 2-19B3

SEC 19-T25-R3W NE/SW
PROPOSED NEW PERFORATIONS

Suggested new infill Wasatch Formation perforations, OWP - CBL
Log September 21, 1985:

11,540-542' - 2' 10,800-802' - 2'
11,487-489' - 2' 10,786-788' - 2'
11,346-348' - 2' 10,765-766' - l'
11,235-236' - l' 10,734-738' - 4'
11,226-228' - 2' 10,719-721' - 2'10,966-970' - 4' 10,679-683' - 4'10,956-960' - 4' 10,639-641' - 2'

10,921-923' - 2' 10,616-617' - l'
10,916-918' - 2' 10,604-608' - 4'10,899-904' - 5' 10,595-597' - 2'
10,878-882' - 4' 10,582-586' - 4'
10,848-850' - 2' 10,568-570' - 2'10,837-838' - l' 10,555-557' - 2'10,826-830' - 4' 10,524-526' - 2'
10,811-814' - 3' 10,496-499' - 3'

30 2ones
77 Feet Perforations

231 Holes
As per CBL - 9-21-85

Total perorations: 420 holes, 69 zones, 140 feet.

WHA-4-28-88
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Form OGC-1b KBW 1N I Ril'I li \

ATE OF UTAH ' tra os on

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES --

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING , LEAss DEg|GNATION kWO SERIAL NO

FEE

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plu back to a diferent reservoir.Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for sue

OIL GAS
wBLL WELL OTHER

2. NAMS 07 OPSSATOg 8. FARM 08 L3Ass NAME

TOTAL MINATOME CORPORATION EVANS
9. wsLL NO.

P.0 BOX 4326 HOUSTON TX 77210-4326 #2-1983

o space IT below.) ALTAMONT/BLUEBELL
11. sec., r., a., u.. os at.x. ana

GUSTST 08 ASSA

1727' FWL & 1675' FSL SEC 19 T2S R3W
14. PERMtT NO. ii. BLETATt0NS ($Êww or Or, RT, Ga. ete,) i COUNTT 08 PAtleM 18. BTATE

42-013-31113 6020 GR DUCHESNE UTAN
is CheckApprepnet. BoxToIndcate Natureof Notice,R•port, or OtherData

NOTICS OF INTENTIOW 20: aussaqumNT 55PORT 07:

TEST WATES SEUTAFF PUf.L OR ALTER castNG waTsa SHUT-Orr REFAixtNO WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE PRACTURS TagaTMENT i ALTERING CAstNO

SHOOT OR ACIDI38 ABANDON* SHOUTING OR ACIDit!NO ABANDONMENT*

ItEPAIR WELL Ct!ANGE PLama (Other) -.

(tints: Report results of multiple completion on Well
lOther) ('umplettan or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

li otscalot runensEn on omrLETED UPERArtoNs (Clearly state all pertinent details. and give pertinent deten, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. It well is directionally drilled, give subsurtsee locations and measured and true vertteal depths for all markers and zones perti.
nons to this work.) •

8/16/88 MOVE IN SERVICE RIG AND PUMP. TEST 7" CSG. TO 3000 PSIG. PULL 2 3/8" & 2 7/8"
TUBING. DRILL OUT 5" BAKER FA-1 PACKER @10,050' KB. CLEAN OUT 5" 18# LINER TO PBTD
OF 11,840'. SET BRIDGE PLUG ON WIRELINE @11,620' WITH 2 SX CMT ON TOP. PERFORATE
ADDITIONAL WASATCH INFILL ZONES AS PER ATTACHMENT. SET PACKER AT 10,050' AND ACIDIZE
WASATCH PERFORATIONS WITH 25,000 GALS. ACID. RETURN WELL TO PRODUCTION 8/24/88.

18. I hereby certity that the toregoing is true and correct

excuno Ôhû £.71£.AÝñ TITLE PRODUCTTON ENGTNRER DATs 9/23/88

(This space for Federal or State ogee use)

AP""AVED ST TITLE DATE
C suu. 25 OF APPROVAI., 17 ANT:

*S.. Instructionson Revers.Side
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AP""AVED ST TITLE DATE
C suu. 25 OF APPROVAI., 17 ANT:

*S.. Instructionson Revers.Side



TOTAL MINATOME CORPORATION
EVANS No. 2-19B3

SEC 19-T2S-R3W NE/SW
PROPOSED NEW PERFORATIONS

Suggested new infill Wasatch Formation perforations, OWP - CBLLog September 21, 1985:

11,540-542' - 2' 10,800-802' - 2'11,487-489' - 2' 10,786-788' - 2'11,346-348' - 2' 10,765-766' - l'11,235-236' - l' 10,734-738' - 4'11,226-228' - 2' 10,719-721' - 2'10,966-970' - 4' 10,679-683' - 4'10,956-960' - 4' 10,639-641' - 2'

10,921-923' - 2' - 10,616-617' - l'10,916-918' - 2' 10,604-608' - 4'10,899-904' - 5' 10,595-597' - 2'10,878-882' - 4' 10,582-586' - 4'10,848-850' - 2' 10,568-570' - 2'10,837-838' - l' 10,555-557' - 2'10,826-830' - 4' 10,524-526' - 2'10,811-814' - 3' 10,496-499' - 3'

30 2ones
77 Feet Perforations

231 Holes
As per CBL - 9-21-85

Total perorations: 420 holes, 69 zones, 140 feet.

WHA-4-28-88
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BBB
TOTAL Minatome Corporation

June 16, 1989

Mr. Ronald J. Firth my y -

Associate Director of Oil & Gas
State of Utah
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining JUN2 19
3 Triad Center - Suite 350
Salt Lake City, UT 84180-1203

Re: Evans #2-19B3
Sec. 19-T2S-R3W
Altamont/Bluebell Field
Duchesne County, Utah

Dear Mr. Firth:

Attached in triplicate, please find Sundry Notice of TOTALMinatome

Corporation's intent to install a salt water disposal line, connecting

the above referenced well to the main system in the field.

Should you have any questions or require additional information,

please contact me at(713) 739-3378.

Sincerely,

Debbie E. Knight
Regulatory Administrator

DEK:cg
(22.39)

2 Houston Center, Suite 2000 • P.O. Box 4326 • Houston, Texas 77210-4326

Telephone (713) 739-3000 • Telecopier (713) 739-3160 • Telex
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D V Form 5
May 5, 1987

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING s. Lamaa usaronarson .ano
esasar, no.

142-0H6-21734
6. 17 INDËAN. At.aÕE OR BIES NAME

SUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS
(De not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposais.)

i.
7. unrr aoans ami šÏisi

otr. gas
wBLle WELI. OTHER

2. xxxx or ormastos
8. raan om La

sa¯niin

TOTALMinatome Corporation Evans

s. anomans or orsanos
e. war.r. no.

P. O. Box 4326 Houston, Texas 77 -

2-19B3

4. I.OCATION OF WELI. (Report location élearly and in accordance wit 10. FIELD AND POOI., 01 WH.DCA

See also space 17 below.)
at .artne•

Altamont/Bl uebel l

1727' FWLand 1675' FSL
u...c....,......o.as.a.a..

JUN211989 """°• "'

Sec. 19-T2S-R3W

• AP I NUMBER 16. at.svATroNs (Show whether Dr. sT. g g.- 12. couxor os raassa 18. s:Ats

43-013-31113 6020' GR 01LBAS&MINING Duchesne Utah

te· CheckAppropnote BoxTo indicate Nature of Notice, Report,or OtherDate

NOTICE OP INTENTION TO:
SURONQUENT REPORT 09:

Tž8T WATER BRUT-Orr PULL 05 ALTER CASING WATER SHUT•OPP REFAIREWO WELE.

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPI.ETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CAalNo

BHOOT OR ACIDIES
ABANDON* BROOTING OR ACIDIZING

ABANDOMMENT*

REPAIR WELL CffANGE PLANs (Other)
(Notz : Report resulta of multiple colapletion on Wel

(Other) IDStal l SWDl ine .

X esmoletion or are..us.con a.port a.« L., rar..>

17. DESCRIDS rnnPOSED OR CUMPLETED OPERATIoNs (Cleurfy state uit pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If weil is directionally drilled. sive subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
.

nent to this work.) •

Proposal:

Install salt water disposal line connecting well to the main system in the field.

18. I hpreby ce that the foreg in d

TITLE
RegUl atOry Administrator 6/16/89

(This space for Federal or State odice use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANT:

*SeeInstructionson Revers.
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mas
TOTAL Minatome Corporation

September 5, 1989

TO ALL WORKING INTEREST OWNERS
(See Attached Addressee List)

RE: Altamont Bluebell
Evans #2-19B3 2 ;
Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

TOTAL Minatome Corporation is resigning, effective October1, 1989, as Operator of the above captioned well. In accordancewith the operating agreement covering the above captioned, TOTALMinatome Corporation nominates and votes for ANR ProductionCompany as successor operator. TOTAL Minatome Corporation's voteand ANR Production Company's approval of same, totals thenecessary majority vote to elect ANR Production Company asOperator.

Since ,

ee . Anderson
L Manager-Onshore

JRA/dc
Enclosure

LETTERS/090589D.DEB

2 Houston Center, Suite 2000 • PO. Box 4326 • Houston, Texas 77210-4326Telephone (713) 739-3000 • Telecopier (713) 739·3160 • Telex
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ANR Production Company The Energy People
A SUBSIDIARY OF THECOASTALCORPORATION

Û1989 OILANDGAS
October 3, 1989

ONOF DRN RJF

JRB GLH

DTS SUS

State of Utah
N(

Department of Natural Resources 5
Division of Oil & Gas
3 Triad Center, Suite 350 - , EAICROFILM

Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203
,ft/df FILES (tys )

Attention: John Baza g- gd SY y).4es 47

Re: ANR Production Company takes over operatorship of wells in Duchesne (e,y,«J)

County.

Dear Mr. Baza:

As of October 1, 1989 ANR Production Company took over operatorship of

eleven wells in the Altamont field, located in Duchesne County, from TOTAL
Minatome Corporation. Please see attached list of wells.

We would ask that the wells be added to our Blanket Bogd. Also attached

are copies of signed letters from TOTAL Minatome Corporation authorizing

this takeover.

If you need further information, please contact me.

Sincerely

Brenda W. Swank
Regulatory Analyst

BWS:dh

Attachments

Lynn Carter-Risk Management
Les Streeb/Well File
Jon Nelsen

600 17THSTREET
SUITE 800S
PO.BOX0749
DENVER, COLORADO80201-0749
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State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

Norman H. Bangerter
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

Governor

Dee C. Hansen
355 West North Temple

Executive Director 3 Triad Center. Suite 350

Dianne R Nielson, Ph.D. Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

Division Director 801-538-5340

November 17, 1989

Mr. Gene W. Anderson
Total Minatome Corporation
P.O. Box 4326
Houston, Texas 77210-4326

Dear Mr. Anderson:

Re: Notification of Lease Sale or Transfer

The division recently received notificationof a change of operator from Total Minatome
Corporation to ANR Production Company for the following wells located on fee leases:

Lamicq 2-5B2 API No. 43-013-30784
Broadhead Unit 2-32BS APl No. 43-013-31036
Hanskutt 2-23BS API No. 43-013-30917
Duncan 2-9B5 API No. 43-013-30719 =

Potter 2-24BS API No. 43-013-31118
Burton 2-15B5 API No. 43-013-31044
Tew 2-1085 API No. 43-013-31125
Ute 2-34A4 API No. 43-013-30978
Evans 2-19B3 API No. 43-013-31113
Rust 3-4B3 API No. 43-013-31070

Rule R615-2-10, of the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules, states:

"The owner of a lease shall provide notification to any person with an
interest in such lease, when all or part of that interest in the lease is sold
or transferred."

an equal opportunity
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Page 2
Mr. Gene Anderson
November 17, 1989

This letter is written to advise Total Minatome Corporation of its responsibility to notify
all individuals with an interest in these leases of the change of operator. Please provide
written documentation of this notificationto the division no later than
December 15, 1989.

Sincerely,

Don Staley
Administrative Supervisor

Idc
cc: D.R. Nielson

R.J. Firth
Well files
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TOTAL TOTAL Minatome CorporationBRM-

December 4, 1989

State of Utah
355 West North Temple UtÛ <

3 Triad Center, Suite 350 se e z.-2tad?
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203 ),cygs,7//Z2

Attention: Don Staley

RE: Altamont/Bluebell Prospect
Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to your letter dated November 17, 1989, enclosed
you will find copies of letters written to the various working
interest owners notifying each party that TOTAL Minatome
Corporation resigned as Operator of the wells listed in your
letter, effective October 1, 1989. These letters to the working
interest owners represent written notification.

Sincerely,

Debbie Copeland
Land Department

dc
Enclosure

2 Houston Center, Suite 2000 • P.O. Box 4326 • Houston, Texas 77210-4326
Telephone (713) 739-3000 • Telecopier (713) 739-3160 • Telex
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EPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

Norman H. Bangerter
IVISION OF OIL, GASAND MINING

Gowrno

Dee C. Hans «
5 West North Temple

Executive Directo nad Center. Suite 350

Dianne R. Nielson, Ph.D. Salt Lake City. Utah 84180-1203

DivisionDin-etor 801-538-5340

November 17, 1989

Mr. Gene W. Anderson
Total Minatome Corporation
P.O. Box 4326
Houston, Texas 77210-4326

Dear Mr. Anderson:

Re: Notification of Lease Sale or Transfer

The division recently received notificationof a change of operator from Total Minatome
Corporation to ANR Production Company for the following wells located on fee leases:

Lamicq 2-582 APl No. 43-013-30784
Broadhead Unit 2-32B5 API No. 43-013-31036
Hanskutt 2-2385 API No. 43-013-30917
Duncan 2-9B5 API No. 43-013-30719
Potter 2-24B5 API No. 43-013-31118
Burton 2-15B5 API No. 43-013-31044
Tew 2-10B5 API No. 43-013-31125
Ute 2-34A4 API No. 43-013-30978
Evans 2-19B3 API No. 43-013-31113
Rust 3-4B3 API No. 43-013-31070

Rule R615-2-10, of the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules, states:

"The owner of a lease shall provide notification to any person with an
interest in such lease, when all or part of that interest in the lease is sold
or transferred."

an equal opportunity
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Form 3\60-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135une1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires: March31,1993

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Designanon and Senal No.
14-20-H62-1734

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. If Indian. Allonee or Tribe Name

TUte Indcian Tribe

i Type of wen CA 9678
O °wi O °w% O Other 8. Well Name armiNo.

L Name of Operator Evans 2-19B3
ANR Production Company 00.,GAS&M 9. API Well No.

3 Address and Telephone No. 43-013-31113
P. O. Box 749, Denver, Colorado 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4 Locanon of Well (Footage. Sec.. T.. R., M., or Survey Descnpuon) AltamOnt

1727 ' FWL & 1675 ' FSL 11. countyor Fansk, state

Section 19, T2S-R3W
Duchesne County, Utah

il CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intem Abandonment Change of Plans

O a....,,.... O New Comuumon
Subsequem Repon Pluggmg Back Non-Ronne Fracanng

O c..., a.,,,, O Water Shut-Off

O Enubudomnem Nake Menng.Canng Convermon m In

Other NTL-2B, II Application DisposeWater
(Note: Reportresuinet muinpiscomplenoson Weil
Compicuon or RecomphangeReport and Log form.)

13. Descnbe Proposed or Completed Operanons (Clearly state all peranent detads, and give pemnem dates, including esumated date of stamng any proposed work. If weil is diracuonally drüled,
give subsurface locanons and measured and true verucal depths for all markers and zones perunent to tius work.)*

ANR Production Company hereby requests permission to dispose of produced water from
the above-referenced well under NTL-2B, II "Disposal in the Subsurface." The produced
water from the Evans 2-19B3 flows into a steel tank equipped with a high level float
switch which shuts the well in if the tank becomes overloaded. The produced water is
then pumped into ANR's underground SWD facilities.

Accepted b State
of Utah DM 1
Oil, Gas er g
Date:
By:

.

14. I hereby era t gomg is : and correct

Signed Tide RegulatOrV AnalVSt Date 1-17-01
(This space for Federal or State office use)

Federal Approval of this
Approved by +; , 7- er - Title DateConditions of approval, if any

Title 18 U.S.C. Secuon 1001. makes it a cnme for any person imowmgly and wülfully to make to any departmem or agency of the United States any false. fictitious or fraudulem statememsor representations as to any maaer within its junadiction.

*See instruction on Reverse
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13. Descnbe Proposed or Completed Operanons (Clearly state all peranent detads, and give pemnem dates, including esumated date of stamng any proposed work. If weil is diracuonally drüled,
give subsurface locanons and measured and true verucal depths for all markers and zones perunent to tius work.)*

ANR Production Company hereby requests permission to dispose of produced water from
the above-referenced well under NTL-2B, II "Disposal in the Subsurface." The produced
water from the Evans 2-19B3 flows into a steel tank equipped with a high level float
switch which shuts the well in if the tank becomes overloaded. The produced water is
then pumped into ANR's underground SWD facilities.

Accepted b State
of Utah DM 1
Oil, Gas er g
Date:
By:

.

14. I hereby era t gomg is : and correct

Signed Tide RegulatOrV AnalVSt Date 1-17-01
(This space for Federal or State office use)

Federal Approval of this
Approved by +; , 7- er - Title DateConditions of approval, if any

Title 18 U.S.C. Secuon 1001. makes it a cnme for any person imowmgly and wülfully to make to any departmem or agency of the United States any false. fictitious or fraudulem statememsor representations as to any maaer within its junadiction.

*See instruction on Reverse



Form .5160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
Budget Bureau No. 10044135

uune 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Excires: March31.1993

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. I.case Designaaon am senalNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. Ulndon. Adonecor inbe Name

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deeoen or reergrydo a different-reserv IL

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposais
7. If Urut or CA, Agreement Designanon

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE
r 0? laa

1. Type or Well 9 L

Oil Gas 8. Weil Name am No.
Well Well Other

2. Name or operator See attached list

ANR Production Company ' ' 9· API Well No.

3. Address ana Telephone No 43-013-

P. O. Box 749, Denver, Colorado 80201-0749 10. Field and Pool. or Exploratory Arca

a Locanon or Well (Footage..Sec.. T.. R.. M.. or Survev Desenpuorn AltamOnt
11. Counav or Pansk. Staan

See attached list Duchesne County, Utah

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intem Amt Chan of Plus

O a...,..... O s.. co. -..

O sum a=,.. O rius,.,...e O Non Rotme Fracunng

O c.., a...., O w.., sa..m

O a==ia- son . O »...,.c.... O co...-... i.»

Ð om., m-an vxesnoon O ois,..w.-
(Nota: Reponresnuset mekapiscomptenoson Well

Compleuen or Recomoesnoe Reson ano A.og form.I

13. Descrioe Proposca or Comoteten Operauons IClearly state all pemnem detads. and give pemnem antes, mciudmg esumated dam or stamng any proposen work. If well asdaracaonally dniled,

give subsurface locauons and measurca and true vemcal depths for all markers and zones pemnem to tlus work.l*

ANR Production Company, as operator of 19 BLM regulated emergency pits in the Altamont/
Bluebell field, (see attached list) respectfully requests an extension for the NTL-2B

application dated February 23, 1990. This application requested a variance to NTL-2B

Section VI, "Temporary Use of Surface Pits."

ANR's intention was to recover waste fluid from these pits, clean up crude contaminated
soils, recontour the emergency pits and then install 500 EBL steel capture vessels for
emergency fluids.

ANR has removed the waste fluid from these pits, but we are currently evaluating the
most effective method of pit cleanup. After this is accomplished the 500 BEL steel
capture vessels will be installed. We will keep you apprised of our status on these
emergency pits.

We apologize for our delay in completing this project, however the costs and complexity
of proper reclamation has required more time than anticipated. Thank you for your
patience and understanding on this matter.

Accepted by the State
14. I hen c

rig, Regulatory An -91

Tide 18 U.S.C. Secnon 1001. maxes at a crune for any person Knowmgly and wtilfully to mahcato any deparanent o a or the United States any iaise. ücunous or fraudulem am

or represemanans as to any maast wittua its yurtsdicaan.

'See instruction on Reverse
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soils, recontour the emergency pits and then install 500 EBL steel capture vessels for
emergency fluids.
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14. I hen c

rig, Regulatory An -91
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'See instruction on Reverse



WELL NAME WELL LOCATION LEASE # CA # API #43-013 TRIBE NAME

Ute #1-35A3 Sec. 35, T1S-R3W 14-20-H62-1802 N/A 30181 Ute

Ute #1-6B2 Sec. 6, T2S-R2W 14-20-H62-1807 N/A 30349 Ute

Ute Tribal #2-33Z2 Sec. 33, T1N-R2W 14-20-H62-1703 9C140 31111 Ute

Ute Tribal #1-33Z2 Sec. 33, T1N-R2W 14-20-H62-1703A 9C140 30334 Ute

Ute #1-34A4 Sec. 34, T1S-RAW 14-20-H62-1774 9640 3007$(, Ute

Ute #1-36A4 Sec. 36, T1S-R4W 14-20-H62-1793 9642 30069 Ute

Ute #1-20B5 Sec. 20, T2S-R5W 14-20-H62-2507 9C000143 30376 Ute

Ute #1-21C5 Sec. 21, T33-R5W 14-20-H62-4123 UTO80IA9-86C699 30448 Ute

Ute Tribal #1-28B4 Sec. 28, T2S-R4W 14-20-H62-1745 9681 30242 Ute

Monsen #1-27A3 Sec. 27, T1S-R3W UTU-0141455 NW581 30145 N/A

Ute #2-31A2 Sec. 31, T1S-R2W 14-20-H62-1801 N/A 31139 Ute

Ute Tribal #1-31Z2 Sec. 31, T1N-R2W 14-20-H62-1801 N/A 30278 Ute

Evans #2-19B3 Sec. 19, T2S-R3W 14-20-H62-1734 9678 31113 Ute

Ute Jenks #2-1B4 Sec. 1, T2S-R4W 14-20-H62-1782 N/A 31197 Uintah & Ouray

Ute #1-184 Sec. 1, T2S-RAW 14-20-H62-1798 9649 30129 Ute

Murdock #2-34B5 Sec. 34, T2S-RSW 14-20-H62-2511 9685 31132 Ute

Ute #1-25B6 Sec. 25, T2S-R6W 14-20-H62-2529 N/A 30439 Ute

Ute Tribal #1-29C5 Sec. 29, T3S-R5W 14-20-H62-2393 9C200 30449 Ute

Ute #2-22B5 Sec. 22, T2S-R5W 14-20-H62-2509 N/A 31122

WELL NAME WELL LOCATION LEASE # CA # API #43-013 TRIBE NAME
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Ute #2-31A2 Sec. 31, T1S-R2W 14-20-H62-1801 N/A 31139 Ute
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Ute #2-22B5 Sec. 22, T2S-R5W 14-20-H62-2509 N/A 31122



Form 3i60-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

June iu90) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR . 3,
3m

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. I.ease oesarnanona.a serm No.

14-20-H62-1734
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS e it inum. auon..or intae sam=

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deeoen or reentry to a alfferent reservoir.
Use "APPUCATION FOR PERMIT-" for sucn orocosals Ute Tribal

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE
7. u umaor ca.«gr......oesas..===

pe or weit CA #9678
Oil Gas 8. Well Name am No.
Well - Well Other

ame or ooeramr Evans #2-19B3

ANR Production Company
9. API Weli No.

Address ana Teleonone No 1 43-013-31113

P. O. Box 749, Denver, Colorado 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 ilo.Fielaanaroot.oresplorasarvAres

Locanon or Weil (Footage. icc.. T.. R.. M., or survevt>escrianon Altamont/Bluebell

1727' FWL & 1675' FSL
li.couarvorearish.sme

Section 19, T2S-R3W Duchesne County, Utah

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Nonce of Intem pa Chanze of Plans

.- O s. ca........

Subsequent Repon Plugging M NwRonne Fracam-s

Oc ... a.,,,, O w... sa...m

Ornu - «.... O s.,., O c........ . .--

Ë ouler NTL-2B Emergency Pit Dispose water
(Nota: Repoitriselligg multipipe-mp-lomon WeA

Comptation er Accomemme Ae--I ana Lag íes--i

13. Descnos Proposen or comotesesOperamms tClearty smo all cemnem Gemás. and give pen--- dates. metudmg esuma-a dam or stamag any propossa wort. It won a dg-Ennnalig did gd,

give Sub5MitaCE inreranna and inBilmi-B and IEUR VErucal demilts for all markers and žODES pert!DEIR to IAIS Work.l*

ANR Production Company hereby requests a variance to NTL-2B Section VI, "Temporary Use

of Surface Pits."

ANR Production Company proposes to close the existing emergency pit using microbial
remediation and install a lined pit. The liner will be seamless, 30 MIL, and 20 year
warranted. Any emergency use of this pit will be reported to your office as soon as
possible and the pit will be emptied and the liquids disposed of in an approved
manner within 48 hours following its use, unless otherwise instructed by your office.

(Please see the attached letter submitted to your office 5/13/91 further describing
this project.)

Accepted by the State
of Utah Divielen of
Oil, Gao ng MAY2 0 1991
Date '

---

DMSIONOF
OILGAS.Br_WRG

[4. I he ce trie ts ano correct

signea title Regulatory Analyst oat. 5-16-91

(This space tor Federal or Stats ortica uses

Approved by Ferieral Apprz2:taLat.ib a Tiyte Dam
Condmom o' M/b??'Ib Necessary

Tide 18 U.S.C. Secune iC01. massa a a crime sur any person knowsagsy asia edifußy to mass e any depar--E er ag-cy or umUama Siams my or å sumamilis
or repr•••••nnan as so any ma-r widim as *

See instruction on Reverse
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ANR Production Company proposes to close the existing emergency pit using microbial
remediation and install a lined pit. The liner will be seamless, 30 MIL, and 20 year
warranted. Any emergency use of this pit will be reported to your office as soon as
possible and the pit will be emptied and the liquids disposed of in an approved
manner within 48 hours following its use, unless otherwise instructed by your office.

(Please see the attached letter submitted to your office 5/13/91 further describing
this project.)
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Date '

---

DMSIONOF
OILGAS.Br_WRG

[4. I he ce trie ts ano correct

signea title Regulatory Analyst oat. 5-16-91

(This space tor Federal or Stats ortica uses

Approved by Ferieral Apprz2:taLat.ib a Tiyte Dam
Condmom o' M/b??'Ib Necessary
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Coastal
The Energy People

:1/CHAE: E ni a ISTER Fo May 13 , 1991
DIRECTOR
ENVIRONMENTAL & SAFETY AFFAIRS
COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION

Tim O'Brien
U.S. Dept. Of The Interior
Bureau of Land Management
Vernal District Office
170 South 500 East
Vernal, Utah 84078

Dear Tim:

The Bureau of Land Management - Vernal District Office is

aware that Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation (COG) is conducting a

pilot program using bioremediation technology as the closure

technique. It is anticipated that the microbial treatment process

will achieve a cost effective closure while eliminating long term
waste disposal liabilities associated with conventional closure

technologies.

COG is approximately 90 days into the pilot program. The

selected pits have been inoculated-and filled to the desired liquid

level. The pit walls and bottoms have been manually turned to
achieve maximum microbial contact.'

'
To date, we are able to

photographically document the success of our efforts. If the
program continues to progress as expected, we will use the

technology as our plan of action for the remaining pits.

Utilizing microbes or any other type of closure technique will

not eliminate the need for emergency containment in the event of an

operating system upset and/or failure. COG respectfully requests,

as part of our plan of action, that your office provide the
necessary approvals to utilize lined emergency pits to meet this
need.

COG shares your concern for protecting groundwater and other

natural resources. We additionally recognize our responsibility to
conduct our operations lawfully, ethically and in an

environmentally responsible manner.

Our project intent is simple. COG will construct an

"emergency pit" immediately adjacent to the existing.pits. The new

pits' size will be held to a minimum, yet large enough to provide
adequate protection. The pit will be lined using a 30 mil, 20 year
warranty, seamless liner. All emergency piping will be removed

from the pit to be closed and diverted to the new lined excavation.
The old pit will be closed by microbe or other closure technology.

Coastal Oil & Gas

Coastal
The Energy People

:1/CHAE: E ni a ISTER Fo May 13 , 1991
DIRECTOR
ENVIRONMENTAL & SAFETY AFFAIRS
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Bureau of Land Management
Vernal District Office
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technology as our plan of action for the remaining pits.

Utilizing microbes or any other type of closure technique will

not eliminate the need for emergency containment in the event of an

operating system upset and/or failure. COG respectfully requests,

as part of our plan of action, that your office provide the
necessary approvals to utilize lined emergency pits to meet this
need.

COG shares your concern for protecting groundwater and other

natural resources. We additionally recognize our responsibility to
conduct our operations lawfully, ethically and in an

environmentally responsible manner.

Our project intent is simple. COG will construct an

"emergency pit" immediately adjacent to the existing.pits. The new

pits' size will be held to a minimum, yet large enough to provide
adequate protection. The pit will be lined using a 30 mil, 20 year
warranty, seamless liner. All emergency piping will be removed

from the pit to be closed and diverted to the new lined excavation.
The old pit will be closed by microbe or other closure technology.

Coastal Oil & Gas



U.S. Dept. of the Interior
May 13, 1991
Page - 2 -

COG feels we are eliminating the potential environmental
liability exposure of the past practice of unlined pits.
Additionally, the new lined pits afford COG, as a prudent operator,
the opportunity to keep the pits clean, remove any liquids as a

result of upset conditions within 48 hours and most importantly the
pit liner will be inspected on a documented scheduled basis for
maximum efficiency. If a problem is noted, corrections will
receive priority attention.

To achieve maximum effectiveness from a microbial treatment
process, warmer temperatures are essential. In order to take
advantage of the summer weather, COG proposes to start our pit
closure program as soon as practical. Therefore, your assistance
in providing the necessary approvals in a timely manner, are key to
the expedient success of this project.

To re-confirm our position, COG conducts its' operations in an
environmentally sound manner. With your office's approval for the
"lined emergency pits", we will -continue with our planned pit
closure program. At the same time this program offers future
protection to the groundwater and other natural resources within
our area of operation.

If there are any questions or if additional information is
needed, please do not hesitate to call.

Very truly yours,

M. E. McAllister, Ph.D.

cc: David Little

bcc: R.L. Bartley
E. Dey
W.L. Donnelly
L.P.

U.S. Dept. of the Interior
May 13, 1991
Page - 2 -
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Form3160-5 UN :D STATES FORMAPPROVED

(June1990) DEPARTMElNT OF THE INTERIOR BudgetBureauNo.1004-Oi35

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993
5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 14-20-H62-1734

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. If indian, Alotteeor Tribe Name

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT' - for such proposals
Ute Indian Tribe

7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE CA#9678

1. Type of Weli 8. Well Name and No.

Oil Well Gas Well Other Evans #2-19B3

2. Name of Operator
9. API Well No.

ANR Production Company
43-013-31113

3. Address and Telephone No. 10. Field and Pool, Or Exploratory Area

P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Altamont
4. Lomtion of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., Or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, State

1727' FWL & 1675' FSL
Section 19-12S-R3W Duchesne Co., UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO IND1CATENATURE OF NOTICE,REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Noticeof Intert Abandonmert Changeof Plans

Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

Final Abandonment Notice AlteringCasing Conversion to injection

other Perf & Acidize Dispose Water
(NOTE: Report resuas of muniple completion on Weil

Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally

drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and truvertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Please see the attached workover procedure to perf and acidize in the subject well.

Accepted by the
Utah Division ofOil, Gas and Mining

FORRECORDONLY
14. I hereby certify thatthefp ing is t e and correct,

Signed / ,
Title District Drilling Manager Date 06/28/94

Ñ.Ò.Shiflett/ ÛË
(This space for Federal or State office uise)

APPROVED BY Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfullyto rrake to any department or agency of the United States any false, ficticious or fraudulent statemerts or

representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse
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WORKOVER PROCEDUhc

EVANS #2-19B3
Section 19-T2S-R39V

Altamorit Field
Duchesne County, Utah

LOCATION: 1.727° FWLand 1.675' FSL

ELEVATION: 6.020 GL: 6.040' KB

TOTALDEPTH: 12.393' PBTD: 11.620' (CIPP)

CASING: 9-5/8". 36#. J-55 ST&C@ 4.016' cmt'd w/ 1298 sxs
7", 26#, N-80 & P-110 LT&C@ 10.200'
cmt w/ 735 sxs
5". 18#, P-110 LT&Cfrom 9.988 - 12.401' cmt w/ 260 sxs

TUBING: 2-7/8" N-80 set at 9977'.

Capacity Burst Collapse
Description ID Drift B/F Psi Psi

9-5/8" 36# J-55 8.921" 8.765" .0773 3520 2020
7" 26# N-80 LT&C 6.276" 6.151" .0382 7240 5410
7" 26# P110 LT&C 6.276" 6.151" .0382 9960 6210
5" 18# P110 4.276" 4.151" .0177 13940 13450

WELLHISTOkt

09/85 Initial Completion. Perforate from 10.9" to 12.338'. 3 SPF. 369
holes. Flowed 639 BOPD,404 MCFPD. 46 MHEDw/ FTP @ 1300 psi on
14/64" choke.

02/86 Acidize with 18.000 gals 15% acid and 17.200 scf N2. Install
hydraulic pump.
Prior Production: 94 80PD, 95 MCFPD,393 BWPD
Post Production: 584 B0PD, 489 MCFPD, 275 BWPD

08/88 Add Wasatch perforations 10.496° to 11.542', 3 SPF. 231 holes.
Acidize with 25.000 gals 15%acid and ball sealers.
Prior Production: 20 BOPD. 20 MCFPD. 165 BWPD
Post Production: 122 BOPD, 98 MCFPD.738 BWPD

PRESENTSTATUS:

Producing 30 BOPD.48 MCFD,186 BWPDon hydraulic pump.

PROCEDURE
1) MIRUservice rig. NDwellhead and NUB0PE. Relo,co TACat +/- 9.977 and

POOHw/ production equipment.

2) RIH w/ COtools. CO5" casing to PBTD@11.620'.

3) PM wireline company. PIH w/ 3-1/8" esg qur '30° phas,ng. 9 SPF and
perforatge the Wasatch formation per the attace=- prognosis from 10.123to 11.594'. 90 feet. 270 holes.

4) PU & RIH w/ 5" Mountain State Arrowset I, 10k. packer with on/off tool andprofile nipple on 3-1/2" N-80 9.3# tubing x-over to 2-7/8" N-80 6.4#tubing. Set packer at +/- 10.050'. (Note top perforation at
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WORKOVERPROCEDURE- Evans #2-19B3 PAGE#2

5) Fill backside. Pressure backside to 2000 psi Acidize perforations
10.123 to 11.594 using 21.000 gals 15% HCL E. rock salt. and ball
sealers as shown on attached schedule. Run A tracer to delineate
stimulated zones.

6) Flow and swab back acid load.

7) If well flows back strongly, drop plug and release from on/off tool. POOH
and LD 3-1/2" tubing. RIH with 2-7/8" tubing. Latch into packer.
Retrieve plug and return well to production

8) RUWestern Atlas. Run Prism log over stimulated interval.

9) When pressure drops and the well quits flowing. RIH w/ production
equipment.

DKD:dkd
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GREATERALTAMONTFIELD
AHR- EVANS#2-1983
SWl4SECTION19, T2S 3W
DUCHESNECOUNTY,UTAH

PERFORATIONSCHEDULE

DEPTHREFERENCE: GearhartDIL,Run#1 (8/12/85)and Run#2 (9/03/85)

11,594' 11,21T 10,895' 10,512' 10,365' 10,247'

11,560' 11,178' 10,889' 10,491' 10,358' 10,239'

11,541' 11,162' 10,871' 10,473' 10,353' 10,231'

11,536' 11,145' 10,867 10,463' 10,343' 10,226'

11,522' 11,12T 10,750' 10,455' 10,335' 10,20T

11,512' 11,122' 10,716' 10,448' 10,331' 10,198'

11,466' 11,088' 10,708' 10,433' 10,32T 10,191'

11,464' 11,084' 10,692' 10,427 10,324' 10,182'

11,452' 11,074' 10,671' 10,418' 10,310' 10,171'

11,391' 11,024' 10,652' 10,414' 10,305' 10,165'

11,383' 11,016' 10,627 10,410' 10,300' 10,154'

11,369' 10,990' 10,566' 10,404' 10,291' 10,152'

11,365' 10,953' 10,553' 10,400' 10,281' 10,142'

11,360' 10,914' 10,539' 10,396' 10,268' 10,127'

11,266' 10,901' 10,518' 10,371' 10,262' 10,123'

Gross LowerGreen River-WasatchInterval: 10,123-11,594', 90 feet, 67 zones

R. J. LaRocque
April14, 1994

RJL:mar

C:\WP51tRJL\PERFS\Ef21983
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Form 3160-5 U TD STATES FORM APPROVED(June 19 DEPARTM, . T OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 14-20-H62-1734
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. If Indian, Alottee or Tribe Name

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMlT' - for such proposals
Ute Indian Tribe

7. If Unitor CA, Agreement Designation

SUBM/T/N TR/PL/CATE CA#9678
1. Type of Well

8. Well Name and No.

Oil Well Gas Well Other Evans #2-19B3
2. Name of Operator

9. API Well No.
ANR Production Company 43-013-31113

3. Address and Telephone No.
10. Field and Pool, Or Exploratory Area

P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Altamont
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., Or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, State

1727' FWL & 1675' FSL
Section 19-T2S--R3W

Duchesne Co., UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE,REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
Notice of intert Abandonmert Change of Plans

Recompletion New Construction
Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off
Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to injection

Other Perf & Acidize Dispose Water
(NOTE: Report results of multþie completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinert details, and give pertinert dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionallydrilled, give subsurface locations and measured and tru vertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Please see the attached chronological history for the CO, perf, and acidize procedure performed in the subject well.

14. I hereby certify thatth goin rue and correct

Signed
Title District Drilling Manager Date 08/05/94N.O. Shifl

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVEDBY Title DateConditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfullyto make to any department or agency of the United States any false, ficticiousor fraudulentstatemerts orrepresentations as to any matter within asjurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse
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THECOASTALCORPORATION
PRODUCTIONREPORT

CHRONOLOGICALHISTORY
EVANS#2-1983 (CLEANOUT.PERF &ACIDIZE) PAGE2ALTAMONTFIELD
DUCHESNECOUNTY,UT
WI: 75.187468% ANR AFE: 00265

7/23/94 RIH w/standing valve.
RIH w/153 jts 2Va" Nu-Lock tbg hydrotesting to 8500#. Set 7" AC@9974' w/18.000# tension. Top of pumpcavity @9631'. RIH w/Nat'lstinger & 315 jts 2Va" Nu-Lock tbg. Sting into pump cavity w/6000#compression. NDBOP. CC: $102,935

7/24/94 Well on production.
Flush 2Va" tbg w/60 BW & 2¥a" tbg w/45 BW. RU Delsco. RIHw/standing valve. Fill dual strings w/45 BW& test to 4000#, held.NUWH.drop pump & return to production. RD. CC: $110.985

7/24/94 Pmpd 30 BO, 234 BW, 60 MCF. PP 3100#, 20 hrs.
7/25/94 Pmpd 99 BO. 301 BW, 117 MCF, PP 3300#.
7/26/94 Pmpd 121 80. 287 BW. 135 MCF, PP 3300#,
7/27/94 Pmpd 136 BO. 269 BW,126 MCF. PP 3400#.
7/28/94 Pmpd 149 BO. 255 BW, 141 MCF, PP 3400#.
7/29/94 Pmpd 144 BO. 368 BW. 150 MCF.
7/30/94 Pmpd 114 BO. 301 BW. 141 MCF.

7/31/94 Pmpd 110 BO. 284 BW. 141 MCF, PP 3400#.
Prior prod: 30 BO. 186 BW, 48 MCF. Final
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CHRONOLOGICALHISTORY
EVANS#2-1983 (CLEANOUT.PERF &ACIDIZE) PAGE2ALTAMONTFIELD
DUCHESNECOUNTY,UT
WI: 75.187468% ANR AFE: 00265

7/23/94 RIH w/standing valve.
RIH w/153 jts 2Va" Nu-Lock tbg hydrotesting to 8500#. Set 7" AC@9974' w/18.000# tension. Top of pumpcavity @9631'. RIH w/Nat'lstinger & 315 jts 2Va" Nu-Lock tbg. Sting into pump cavity w/6000#compression. NDBOP. CC: $102,935

7/24/94 Well on production.
Flush 2Va" tbg w/60 BW & 2¥a" tbg w/45 BW. RU Delsco. RIHw/standing valve. Fill dual strings w/45 BW& test to 4000#, held.NUWH.drop pump & return to production. RD. CC: $110.985

7/24/94 Pmpd 30 BO, 234 BW, 60 MCF. PP 3100#, 20 hrs.
7/25/94 Pmpd 99 BO. 301 BW, 117 MCF, PP 3300#.
7/26/94 Pmpd 121 80. 287 BW. 135 MCF, PP 3300#,
7/27/94 Pmpd 136 BO. 269 BW,126 MCF. PP 3400#.
7/28/94 Pmpd 149 BO. 255 BW, 141 MCF, PP 3400#.
7/29/94 Pmpd 144 BO. 368 BW. 150 MCF.

7/30/94 Pmpd 114 BO. 301 BW. 141 MCF.

7/31/94 Pmpd 110 BO. 284 BW. 141 MCF, PP 3400#.
Prior prod: 30 BO. 186 BW, 48 MCF. Final



THE COASTALCORPORATION
PRODUCTIONREPORT

CHRONOLOGICALHISTORY
EVANS#2-19B3 (CLEANOUT,PERF & ACIDIZE) PAGE1ALTAMONTFIELD
DUCHESNECOUNTY,UT
WI: 75.187468% ANR AFE: 00265TD: 12.393' '

PBTD: 11.620 '
5" LINER @ 9988'-12.401
PERFS: 10.123·-12.338'

(WASATCH)
CWC(M$): 122.0

7/14/94 POOHw/tbg & BHA.
RU PU rig #1455. LD pump. RU 2¥a" tbg equip. NDWH. NUBOP. POOHw/pump cavity @9629 w/2Va" sidestring & flush w/45 BW. POOHw/315jts 2¥a" Nu-Lock tbg & Nat'1 stinger. RU 29's" tbg equip. R1s AC@9977°. Flush tbg w/60 BW. POOHw/100 jts 2Va" Nu-Lock tbg, EOT@6908°. CC: $4.293

7/15/94 CO5" liner.
POOHw/213 jts 2Va" Nu-Lock tbg & BHA. RIH w/4Va" mill & COassembly, 34 jts 2Va" & 282 jts 2Va Nu-Lock tbg to 9796 . CC: $7,255

7/16-17/94 SD for weekend.

7/18/94 RU OWP. prep to perf.
RIH, tag bridge @10.044'. RIH to PBTD@11.620'. Stroke COtool.POOHw/336 jts 2Va" tbg. 34 jts 2Va" tbg & CO assembly. LD COassembly - COassembly full of wax & wtr. no solids. Change tbg &BOP equip for 3½". CC: $12.287

7/19/94 PU 3½" tbg.
RU OWP. Perf well @ 10.123 -11.594' (270 holes) w/3Va" csg guns.3 SPF, 120° phasing.

Run # Interval Feet Holes PSI FL
1 11.088'-11.594' 22 66 0 7100'2 10.518'-11.084 23 69 0 71003 10,324'-10.512° 23 69 0 70004 10.123'-10.310 22

_5§ 0 7000
Total 9_g' 2|Q

RDOWP. RIH w/nipple, 1-jt 2Va". Mtn States 5" Arrowset 10K pkr.3 jts 2Va" tbg. No-Go&210 jts 3½" 9.3# tbg to 6538°. CC: $33.882
7/20/94 Continue swabbing.

PU 117 jts 3½" tbg. Set pkr @ 10.077 w/30.000# compression.Fill csq w/171 BW&test to 1500#
_be34, RUDowell. Acidize perfs'TFin'10,123'-12.338' w/21.000 gal 15% HCl. BAF. rock salt. 1050 -1.1 ball sealers & 3-RA tags. MTP9000#, ATP 8300#, MTR41 BPM,ATR26 BPM,min trtg rate 19 BPM. ISIP 4500#. 15 min 1720#. Gooddiversion. 1046 BLTR. RDDowell. RUswabequip. Made 6 runs & rec51 BW.FFL 5200 . CC: $86.458

7/21/94 POOHw/3½" tbg.
RUswab equip. Made 14 runs & rec 94 BW& 24 80/5 hrs. FFL 4600'.pH 6.0. oil cut 20%. 24 BPH. Rls 5" pkr @10.027 . Work tbg for1-hr to pull pkr thru liner @9991°. LD 3 jts tbg to 9968'. RUAtlas to run Prism Log. Log perfs from 10.123° to 11.594 - couldnot get below 11,606

. POOH& LD63 jts 3½" tbg. CC: $94.717
7/22/94 Continue hydrotesting.

POOH& LD264 jts 3½" tbg & 5" pkr. Test pump cavity to 9000#.RIH w/7" AC, BHA& V series pump cavity. RIH w/hydrotester & 160jts 2Va" Nu-Lock tbg to 5777'. testing to 8500#. CC:
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WI: 75.187468% ANR AFE: 00265TD: 12.393' '

PBTD: 11.620 '
5" LINER @ 9988'-12.401
PERFS: 10.123·-12.338'

(WASATCH)
CWC(M$): 122.0

7/14/94 POOHw/tbg & BHA.
RU PU rig #1455. LD pump. RU 2¥a" tbg equip. NDWH. NUBOP. POOHw/pump cavity @9629 w/2Va" sidestring & flush w/45 BW. POOHw/315jts 2¥a" Nu-Lock tbg & Nat'1 stinger. RU 29's" tbg equip. R1s AC@9977°. Flush tbg w/60 BW. POOHw/100 jts 2Va" Nu-Lock tbg, EOT@6908°. CC: $4.293

7/15/94 CO5" liner.
POOHw/213 jts 2Va" Nu-Lock tbg & BHA. RIH w/4Va" mill & COassembly, 34 jts 2Va" & 282 jts 2Va Nu-Lock tbg to 9796 . CC: $7,255

7/16-17/94 SD for weekend.

7/18/94 RU OWP. prep to perf.
RIH, tag bridge @10.044'. RIH to PBTD@11.620'. Stroke COtool.POOHw/336 jts 2Va" tbg. 34 jts 2Va" tbg & CO assembly. LD COassembly - COassembly full of wax & wtr. no solids. Change tbg &BOP equip for 3½". CC: $12.287

7/19/94 PU 3½" tbg.
RU OWP. Perf well @ 10.123 -11.594' (270 holes) w/3Va" csg guns.3 SPF, 120° phasing.

Run # Interval Feet Holes PSI FL
1 11.088'-11.594' 22 66 0 7100'2 10.518'-11.084 23 69 0 71003 10,324'-10.512° 23 69 0 70004 10.123'-10.310 22

_5§ 0 7000
Total 9_g' 2|Q

RDOWP. RIH w/nipple, 1-jt 2Va". Mtn States 5" Arrowset 10K pkr.3 jts 2Va" tbg. No-Go&210 jts 3½" 9.3# tbg to 6538°. CC: $33.882
7/20/94 Continue swabbing.

PU 117 jts 3½" tbg. Set pkr @ 10.077 w/30.000# compression.Fill csq w/171 BW&test to 1500#
_be34, RUDowell. Acidize perfs'TFin'10,123'-12.338' w/21.000 gal 15% HCl. BAF. rock salt. 1050 -1.1 ball sealers & 3-RA tags. MTP9000#, ATP 8300#, MTR41 BPM,ATR26 BPM,min trtg rate 19 BPM. ISIP 4500#. 15 min 1720#. Gooddiversion. 1046 BLTR. RDDowell. RUswabequip. Made 6 runs & rec51 BW.FFL 5200 . CC: $86.458

7/21/94 POOHw/3½" tbg.
RUswab equip. Made 14 runs & rec 94 BW& 24 80/5 hrs. FFL 4600'.pH 6.0. oil cut 20%. 24 BPH. Rls 5" pkr @10.027 . Work tbg for1-hr to pull pkr thru liner @9991°. LD 3 jts tbg to 9968'. RUAtlas to run Prism Log. Log perfs from 10.123° to 11.594 - couldnot get below 11,606

. POOH& LD63 jts 3½" tbg. CC: $94.717
7/22/94 Continue hydrotesting.

POOH& LD264 jts 3½" tbg & 5" pkr. Test pump cavity to 9000#.RIH w/7" AC, BHA& V series pump cavity. RIH w/hydrotester & 160jts 2Va" Nu-Lock tbg to 5777'. testing to 8500#. CC:



Form aico-s UNIND STATES ,WM

pune logo) DEPARTME, OF THE INTERIOR BudgetBureauNo.1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March31,1993
5. Lease Designation and Senal No.

- i 199
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

' 14-20-H62-1734

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. If Indian, AlotteeorTribeName

Use "APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT" - for such proposals
Ute Indian Tribe

7. If Unitor CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE CA#9678
1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.

oliweil aa.weit other Evans #2-19B3

2. Name of Operator 9. API Well No.

ANR Production Company 43-013-31113

1 ?.1 re•r N!-phora No 10. Field and Pool Or Exoloratorv Aron

P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Altamont
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., Or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, State

1727' FWL & 1675' FSL
Section 19-T2S-R3W Duchesne Co., UT

12. CHECKAPPROPRIATEBOX(S)TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE,REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

Notice of Intert Abandonmert Change of Plans

a........ New Construction

Ð sue..su.nta.no,« slussione.= Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

Final Abandonment Notice AlteringCasing Conversion to injection

Other Perf & Acidize oi.pos.water
(NOTE: Report results of multiple mmpletion on Wou

Compistion or Recompinion and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinert details, and give pertinert dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. Ifwell is directionally

drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and tru vertical depths for all trarkets and zones pertinentto this work.)*

Please see the attached chronological history for the CO, perf, and acidize procedure performed in the subject well.

hereÑcertify t hadoregoin true and correct

Signed ;
* Tme District Drilling Manager out. 08/05/94

RO. S11ifl† .

(This space for Federal or S

APPROVED BY Tde Date
Conditions of approval, ifany:

Title18 U.S.C.Section 1001, makesita crimeforany person knowinglyand willfullyto make to any departmentor agency of the UnitedStates any false, ficticiousor fraudulentstatemerts or

representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse
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BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March31,1993
5. Lease Designation and Senal No.

- i 199
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

' 14-20-H62-1734

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. If Indian, AlotteeorTribeName

Use "APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT" - for such proposals
Ute Indian Tribe

7. If Unitor CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE CA#9678
1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.

oliweil aa.weit other Evans #2-19B3

2. Name of Operator 9. API Well No.

ANR Production Company 43-013-31113

1 ?.1 re•r N!-phora No 10. Field and Pool Or Exoloratorv Aron

P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Altamont
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., Or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, State

1727' FWL & 1675' FSL
Section 19-T2S-R3W Duchesne Co., UT

12. CHECKAPPROPRIATEBOX(S)TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE,REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

Notice of Intert Abandonmert Change of Plans

a........ New Construction

Ð sue..su.nta.no,« slussione.= Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

Final Abandonment Notice AlteringCasing Conversion to injection

Other Perf & Acidize oi.pos.water
(NOTE: Report results of multiple mmpletion on Wou

Compistion or Recompinion and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinert details, and give pertinert dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. Ifwell is directionally

drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and tru vertical depths for all trarkets and zones pertinentto this work.)*

Please see the attached chronological history for the CO, perf, and acidize procedure performed in the subject well.

hereÑcertify t hadoregoin true and correct

Signed ;
* Tme District Drilling Manager out. 08/05/94

RO. S11ifl† .

(This space for Federal or S

APPROVED BY Tde Date
Conditions of approval, ifany:

Title18 U.S.C.Section 1001, makesita crimeforany person knowinglyand willfullyto make to any departmentor agency of the UnitedStates any false, ficticiousor fraudulentstatemerts or

representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse



THECOASTALCORPORATION
PRODUCTIONREPORT

CHRONOLOGICALHISTORY

EVANS#2-19B3 (CLEANOUT.PERF&ACIDIZE) PAGE2
ALTAMONTFIELD
DUCHESNECOUNTY,UT
WI: 75.187468% ANR AFE: 00265

7/23/94 RIH w/standing valve.
RIH w/153 jts 2Va" Nu-Lock tbg hydrotesting to 8500#. Set 7" AC@
9974' w/18.000# tension. Top of pumpcavity @9631 . RIH w/Nat'1
stinger &315 jts 2Va" Nu-Lock tbg. Sting into pumpcavity w/6000#
compression. NDBOP. CC: $102.935

7/24/94 Well on production.
Flush 2Va" tbg w/60 BW& 2¥a" tbg w/45 BW. RU Delsco. RIH
w/standing valve. Fill dual strings w/45 BW& test to 4000#, held.
NU WH. drop pump& return to production. RD. CC: $110.985

7/24/94 Pmpd30 BO. 234 BW.60 MCF.PP 3100#. 20 hrs.

7/25/94 Pmpd 99 BO. 301 BW.117 MCF.PP 3300#.

7/26/94 Pmpd121 80. 287 BW.135 MCF,PP 3300#.

7/27/94 Pmpd136 BO. 269 BW.126 MCF.PP 3400#.

7/28/94 Pmpd149 BO. 255 BW,141 MCF.PP 3400#.

7/29/94 Pmpd144 80. 368 BW.150 MCF.

7/30/94 Pmpd114 80. 301 BW.141 MCF.

7/31/94 Pmpd110 BO. 284 BW.141 MCF.PP 3400#.

Prior prod: 30 BO. 186 BW.48 MCF. Final

THECOASTALCORPORATION
PRODUCTIONREPORT

CHRONOLOGICALHISTORY

EVANS#2-19B3 (CLEANOUT.PERF&ACIDIZE) PAGE2
ALTAMONTFIELD
DUCHESNECOUNTY,UT
WI: 75.187468% ANR AFE: 00265

7/23/94 RIH w/standing valve.
RIH w/153 jts 2Va" Nu-Lock tbg hydrotesting to 8500#. Set 7" AC@
9974' w/18.000# tension. Top of pumpcavity @9631 . RIH w/Nat'1
stinger &315 jts 2Va" Nu-Lock tbg. Sting into pumpcavity w/6000#
compression. NDBOP. CC: $102.935

7/24/94 Well on production.
Flush 2Va" tbg w/60 BW& 2¥a" tbg w/45 BW. RU Delsco. RIH
w/standing valve. Fill dual strings w/45 BW& test to 4000#, held.
NU WH. drop pump& return to production. RD. CC: $110.985

7/24/94 Pmpd30 BO. 234 BW.60 MCF.PP 3100#. 20 hrs.

7/25/94 Pmpd 99 BO. 301 BW.117 MCF.PP 3300#.

7/26/94 Pmpd121 80. 287 BW.135 MCF,PP 3300#.

7/27/94 Pmpd136 BO. 269 BW.126 MCF.PP 3400#.

7/28/94 Pmpd149 BO. 255 BW,141 MCF.PP 3400#.

7/29/94 Pmpd144 80. 368 BW.150 MCF.

7/30/94 Pmpd114 80. 301 BW.141 MCF.

7/31/94 Pmpd110 BO. 284 BW.141 MCF.PP 3400#.

Prior prod: 30 BO. 186 BW.48 MCF. Final



THECOASTALCORPORATION
PRODUCTIONREPORT

CHRONOLOGICALHISTORY

EVANS#2-19B3 (CLEANOUT.PERF & ACIDIZE) PAGE1
ALTAMONTFIELD
DUCHESNECOUNTY.UT
WI: 75.187468% ANR AFE: 00265
TD: 12.393 PBTD:11.620'
5" LINER@9988 -12.401'

PERFS: 10.123·-12.338' (WASATCH)
CWC(MS): 122.0

7/14/94 POOHw/tbg & BHA.
. RUFu l ig #1455. LDpailiµ. RU2½" tbg equip NOW. Fat BüP PuüW

w/pump cavity @9629 w/244" sidestring & flush w/45 BW. POOHw/315
jts 246" Nu-Lock tbg & Nat'l stinger. RU 254" tbg equip. Rls AC@
9977'. Flush tbg w/60 BW. POOHw/100 jts 255" Nu-Lock tbg. E0T @
6908 . CC: $4.293

7/15/94 CO5" liner.
POOHw/213 jts 25k" Nu-Lock tbg & BHA. RIH w/494" mill & CO
assembly. 34 jts 246" &282 jts 25¾Nu-Locktbg to 9796°. CC: $7.255

7/16-17/94 SD for weekend.

7/18/94 RUOWP.prep to perf.
RIH. tag bridge @10.044°. RIH to PBTD@11.620 . Stroke COtool.
POOHw/336 jts 254" tbg, 34 jts 246" tbg & CO assembly. LD CO
assembly - COassembly full of wax &wtr. no solids. Change tbg &
BOPequip for 3½". CC: $12.287

7/19/94 PU 3½" tbg.
RUOWP. Perf well @ 10.123'-11.594' (270 holes) w/39h" csg guns.
3 SPF. 120° phasing.

Run # Interval Engt_ Holes 251 EL
1 11.088'-11.594' 22 66 0 7100
2 10.518'-11.084° 23 69 0 7100
3 10.324'-10.512° 23 69 0 7000
4 10.123°-10.310' 22 _gg

0 7000
Total gg ¿LQ

RDOWP. RIH w/nipple. 1-jt 254". Mtn States 5" Arrowset 10K pkr.
3 jts 2Va" tbg. No-Go&210 jts 3½" 9.3# tbg to 6538'. CC: $33.882

7/20/94 Continue swabbing.
PU 117 jts 3½" tbg. Set pkr @ 10.077' w/30.000# compression.
Fill csg w/171 BW& test to 1500#. held. RUDowell. Acidize perfs
from 10.123°-12.338' w/21.000 gal 15%HC1, BAF. rock salt. 1050 -

1.1 ball sealers & 3-RA tags. MTP9000#, ATP8300#. MTR41 BPM,
ATR26 BPM.min trtg rate 19 BPM. ISIP 4500#, 15 min 1720#. Good
diversion, 1046 BLTR. RDDowell. RUswab equip. Made6 runs & rec
51 BW.FFL 5200 . CC: $86.458

7/21/94 POOHw/3½" tbg.
RUswabequip. Made 14 runs & rec 94 BW& 24 80/5 hrs. FFL 4600'.
pH 6.0. oil cut 20%. 24 BPH. R1s 5" pkr @10.027'. Work tbg for1-hr to pull pkr thru liner @9991'. LD 3 jts tbg to 9968°. RU
Atlas to run Prism Log. Log perfs from 10.123° to 11.594' - could
not get below 11.606°. POOH& LD63 jts 3½" tbg. CC: $94.717

7/22/94 Continue hydrotesting.
POOH& LD 264 jts 3½" tbg & 5" pkr. Test pump cavity to 9000#.
RIH w/7" AC. BHA& V series pumpcavity. RIH w/hydrotester & 160
jts 2Va" Nu-Lock tbg to 5777'. testing to 8500#. CC:
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EVANS#2-19B3 (CLEANOUT.PERF & ACIDIZE) PAGE1
ALTAMONTFIELD
DUCHESNECOUNTY.UT
WI: 75.187468% ANR AFE: 00265
TD: 12.393 PBTD:11.620'
5" LINER@9988 -12.401'

PERFS: 10.123·-12.338' (WASATCH)
CWC(MS): 122.0

7/14/94 POOHw/tbg & BHA.
. RUFu l ig #1455. LDpailiµ. RU2½" tbg equip NOW. Fat BüP PuüW

w/pump cavity @9629 w/244" sidestring & flush w/45 BW. POOHw/315
jts 246" Nu-Lock tbg & Nat'l stinger. RU 254" tbg equip. Rls AC@
9977'. Flush tbg w/60 BW. POOHw/100 jts 255" Nu-Lock tbg. E0T @
6908 . CC: $4.293

7/15/94 CO5" liner.
POOHw/213 jts 25k" Nu-Lock tbg & BHA. RIH w/494" mill & CO
assembly. 34 jts 246" &282 jts 25¾Nu-Locktbg to 9796°. CC: $7.255

7/16-17/94 SD for weekend.

7/18/94 RUOWP.prep to perf.
RIH. tag bridge @10.044°. RIH to PBTD@11.620 . Stroke COtool.
POOHw/336 jts 254" tbg, 34 jts 246" tbg & CO assembly. LD CO
assembly - COassembly full of wax &wtr. no solids. Change tbg &
BOPequip for 3½". CC: $12.287

7/19/94 PU 3½" tbg.
RUOWP. Perf well @ 10.123'-11.594' (270 holes) w/39h" csg guns.
3 SPF. 120° phasing.

Run # Interval Engt_ Holes 251 EL
1 11.088'-11.594' 22 66 0 7100
2 10.518'-11.084° 23 69 0 7100
3 10.324'-10.512° 23 69 0 7000
4 10.123°-10.310' 22 _gg

0 7000
Total gg ¿LQ

RDOWP. RIH w/nipple. 1-jt 254". Mtn States 5" Arrowset 10K pkr.
3 jts 2Va" tbg. No-Go&210 jts 3½" 9.3# tbg to 6538'. CC: $33.882

7/20/94 Continue swabbing.
PU 117 jts 3½" tbg. Set pkr @ 10.077' w/30.000# compression.
Fill csg w/171 BW& test to 1500#. held. RUDowell. Acidize perfs
from 10.123°-12.338' w/21.000 gal 15%HC1, BAF. rock salt. 1050 -

1.1 ball sealers & 3-RA tags. MTP9000#, ATP8300#. MTR41 BPM,
ATR26 BPM.min trtg rate 19 BPM. ISIP 4500#, 15 min 1720#. Good
diversion, 1046 BLTR. RDDowell. RUswab equip. Made6 runs & rec
51 BW.FFL 5200 . CC: $86.458

7/21/94 POOHw/3½" tbg.
RUswabequip. Made 14 runs & rec 94 BW& 24 80/5 hrs. FFL 4600'.
pH 6.0. oil cut 20%. 24 BPH. R1s 5" pkr @10.027'. Work tbg for1-hr to pull pkr thru liner @9991'. LD 3 jts tbg to 9968°. RU
Atlas to run Prism Log. Log perfs from 10.123° to 11.594' - could
not get below 11.606°. POOH& LD63 jts 3½" tbg. CC: $94.717

7/22/94 Continue hydrotesting.
POOH& LD 264 jts 3½" tbg & 5" pkr. Test pump cavity to 9000#.
RIH w/7" AC. BHA& V series pumpcavity. RIH w/hydrotester & 160
jts 2Va" Nu-Lock tbg to 5777'. testing to 8500#. CC:



FORM 9 STATE OF UTAH
DIVISIOA ? OIL, GAS AND MINING

5. Lease Desgnation and Serial Number:

See Attached
6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS See Attached

Do not use this form for proposals to dril new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 7. Unit Agreement Name:
Use APPLICATION FOR PERMlT TO DRILLOR DEEPEN form for such proposals. See Attached

1. Type of Well:
8. Well Name and Number:OIL GAS OTHER: See Attached

2. Name of Operator:
9. APl Well Number:Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation See Attached

3. Address and Telephone Number:
10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455 See Attached

4 Location of Weil

Footages: See Attached
County: See Attached

QQ, Sec., T., R., M.: See Attached state: Utah
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit in Diplicate} (Submit Original Form Only)

Abandon New Construction Abandon * New Construction
Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing
Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans Perforate
Convert to injection Perforate Convert to injection Vent or Flare
Fracture Treat or Acidize Vent or Flare Fracture Treat or Acidize Water Shut-Off
Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off Other Change of Operator
Other

Date of work completion
Approximate date work will start Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELLCOMPLETIONOR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and truevertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)

Please be advised that effective December 27, 1995,ANR Production Company relinquished and Coastal Oil & Gas Corporationassumed operations for the subject wells (see attached). Bond coverage pursuant to 43 CFR 3104 for lease activities is beingprovided by Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation under the following bonds: State of Utah #102103, BLM Nationwide Bond#U605382-9, and BIA Nationwide Bond #11-40-66A. Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation, as operator, agrees to be responsibleunder the terms and conditions of the leases for the operations conducted upon leased lands.

B nie Carson, Sr. Environmental & Safety Analyst
ANR Production Company

OF C L, GAS & MININ
Sheila Bremer

13.

Environmental & Safety AnalystName & Signature:
Title: COastal Oil & Gas Corporat oate: 03/07/96

(This space for State use only)

(5/94)
(See Instructions on Reverse

FORM 9 STATE OF UTAH
DIVISIOA ? OIL, GAS AND MINING

5. Lease Desgnation and Serial Number:

See Attached
6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS See Attached

Do not use this form for proposals to dril new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 7. Unit Agreement Name:
Use APPLICATION FOR PERMlT TO DRILLOR DEEPEN form for such proposals. See Attached

1. Type of Well:
8. Well Name and Number:OIL GAS OTHER: See Attached

2. Name of Operator:
9. APl Well Number:Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation See Attached

3. Address and Telephone Number:
10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455 See Attached

4 Location of Weil

Footages: See Attached
County: See Attached

QQ, Sec., T., R., M.: See Attached state: Utah
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
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Fracture Treat or Acidize Vent or Flare Fracture Treat or Acidize Water Shut-Off
Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off Other Change of Operator
Other
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Approximate date work will start Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELLCOMPLETIONOR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and truevertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)

Please be advised that effective December 27, 1995,ANR Production Company relinquished and Coastal Oil & Gas Corporationassumed operations for the subject wells (see attached). Bond coverage pursuant to 43 CFR 3104 for lease activities is beingprovided by Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation under the following bonds: State of Utah #102103, BLM Nationwide Bond#U605382-9, and BIA Nationwide Bond #11-40-66A. Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation, as operator, agrees to be responsibleunder the terms and conditions of the leases for the operations conducted upon leased lands.

B nie Carson, Sr. Environmental & Safety Analyst
ANR Production Company

OF C L, GAS & MININ
Sheila Bremer

13.

Environmental & Safety AnalystName & Signature:
Title: COastal Oil & Gas Corporat oate: 03/07/96

(This space for State use only)

(5/94)
(See Instructions on Reverse



CHANGE OF OPERATOR - From ANR Production Co. To Coastal Oil & Gas Corp.
03/07/96 -- Page 3 of 4

If Indian, LOCATIONCF INELXLease Designation
, Allottee or SeWe/I Name &No. API No. & Serial Number Tribe Name CA No. Footages &Range Field County

Miles 2-1B5 43-013-31257 Fee 0 2 N/A N/A 1567' FSL & 1868' FWL NESW, 1-2S-5W Altamont DuchesneMiles 2-3B3 43-013-31261 Fee || N/A N/A 2078' FSL &247T FWL NESW, 3-2S-3W Altamont DuchesneMonsen 1-21A3 43-013-30082 Patented |¶ N/A N/A 1546' FNL& 705' FEL SENE, 21-1S-3W Altamont DuchesneMonsen 2-22A3 43-013-31265 Fee //0 g N/A N/A 1141 FSL & 251' FWL SWSW, 22-1S-3W Altamont DuchesneMurdock 2-26B5 _ 43-013-31124 Fee /5 ) N/A N/A 852' FWL& 93T FSL SWSW, 26-2S-5W Altamont DuchesnePotter 1-24B5 43-013-30356 Patented 0 N/A N/A 1110' FNL & 828' FEL SENE,_24-2S-5W Altamont DuchesnePotter 1-2B5 43 01Š-30293 Patented // N/A N/A 1832' FNL & 1385' FEL SWNE, 2-2S-5W Altamont DuchesnePotter 2-24B5 43-013-31118 Fee 'jf N/A N/A 922' FWL&2124' FSL NWSW, 24-2S-5V\Ï Altamont DuchesnePotter 2-6B4 43-013-31249 Fee j ¶g N/A N/A 151T FSL & 1732' FWL NESW, 6-2S-4W Altamont DuchesnePowell 1-33A3 43-013-30105 Fee N/A N/A 2340' FNL &660' FEL SENE, 33-1S-3W Altamont Duchesneell 2-33A3 43-013-30704 Fee pf; N/A N/A 1582' FSL & 1558' FWL NESW, 33-1S-3W Altamont DuchesneReeder 1-17B5 43-013-30218 Patented |O N/A N/A 1619' FNL &563' FEL SENE, 17-2S-5W Altamont DuchesneRemington 1-34A3 43-013-30139 _ Patented N/A N/A 919' FNL& 1596' FEL NWNE, 34-1S-3W Altamont DuchesneRemington 2-34A3 43-013-31091 Fee p N/A N/A 1645' FWL & 1833' FSL NESW, 34-1S-3W Altamont DuchesenRoger 1-14B3 43-013-30217 Fee N/A N/A 1623' FNL& 2102' FWL SENW, 14-2S-3W Bluebell DuchesneRust 1-4B3 43-013-30063 Patented § N/A N/A 2030' FNL& 660' FEL SENE, 4-2S-3W Altamont DuchesneRust 3-4B3 43-013-31070 Fee 57 N/A N/A 1072' FSL & 1460' FWL SESW, 4-2S-3W Altamont DuchesneSmith 1-31B5 43-013-30577 Fee N/A N/A 2232' FSL & 1588' FEL NWSE, 31-2S-5W Altamont DuchesneState 1-19B1 43-013-30688 N/A N/A 1043' FWL & 1298' FNL NWNW, 19-2S-1W _Bluebell Duchesne3-013-31376 Fee | N/A N/A 1347' FNL & 1134' FWL CNW, 29-1S-3W Altamont DuchesneTew 1-15A3 43-013-30529 Fee N/A N/A 1215' FEL_& 1053' FNL NENE, 15-1S-3W Altamont DuchesneTew 1-185 43-013-30264 Patented N/A N/A 1558' FNL&671' FEL NENE, 1-2S-5W Altamont DuchesneTodd 2-21A3 43-013-31296 Fee j N/A N/A 2456' FSL & 1106' FWL NWSW, 21-1S-3W Bluebell DuchesneWeikert 2-29B4 43-013-31298 Fee N/A NÏA
¯

1528' FNE& 1051' FWL SWNW, 29-2S-4W Bluebell DuchesneWhitehead 1-22A3 43-013-30357 Patented | N/A N/A 2309' FNL& 2450' FEL SWNE, 22-1S-3W Altamont DuchesneWinkler 1-28A3 43-013-30191 Patented | 50 N/A N/A 660' FNL & 1664' FEL NWNE, 28-1S-3W Altamont DuchesneWinkler 2-28A3 43-013-31109 Fee fr/5| N/A N/A 1645' FWL & 919' FSL SESW, _28-1S-3W Altamont _ DuchesneWright 2-13B5 43-013-31267 Fee Il 5 N/A N/A 2442' FNL& 2100' FWL SENW, 13-2S-5W Altamont DuchesneYoung 1-29B4 43-013-30246 Patented N/A N/A 2311' FNL& 876' FEL SENE, 29-2S-4W Altamont Duchesneoung 2-15A3 43-013-31301 Fee ) N/A N/A 182T FWL & 1968' FWL NWSW, 15-1S-3W_ Altamont Duchesneng 2-30B4 43-013-31366 Fee || NIA N/A 2400' FNL& 1600' FWL SENW, 30-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneUte Tribal 2-21B6 43-013-31424 14-20-H62-2489 | § Ute 9639 1226' FSL & 1306' FEL SESE, 22-2S-6W Altamont Duchesne fin1-34A4 43-0 0076 14-20-H62-1774 | $ Ute 9640 1050' FWL & 1900' FNL SWNW,_12-2S-3W Bluebell Duchesne '/6YUte 1-36A4 43-013-30069 14-20-H62-1793 jg Ute 9642 1544' FEL & 1419' FNL SWNE, 28-2S-4W Altamont _ Duchesne '7&SIUte 1-1B4 43-013-30129 14-20-H62-1798 |Ÿû0 Ute 9649 500' FNL &2380' FWL NENW, 1-2S-4W Altamont DuchesneUte Jenks 2-1B4 43-013-31197 14-20-H62-1782 jogift Ute 9649 1167' FSL &920' FWL SWSW, 33-1N-2W Bluebell Duchesne 1C oEvans 2-19B3 43-013-31113 14-20-H62-1734 |-Frf Ute 9678 983' FSL & 683' FEL SESE, 21-2S-6W ¯
Altamont Duchesni ¾69Ute 3-12B3 43-013-31379 14-20-H62-1810 ||fffp Ute 9679 2219' FNL&2213' FEL SWNE, 8-1S-1E Bluebell Uintah 1032Ute 1-28B4 43-013-30242 14-20-H62-1745 Ute 9681 1727' FWL& 167ÚFSL NESW, 19-2S-3W Altamont Duchesne Slo?€Murdock 2-34B5 43-013-31132 14-20-H62-2511 Ute 9685 1420' FNL & 1356' FEL SWNE, 34-1S-4W Altamont Duchesne %90Ute Tribal 10-13A4 43-013-30301 14-20-H62-1685 _ /;UT Ute 9C-126 2230' FNL& 1582' FEL SWNE, 33-1N-2W Bluebell Duchesne SC-F/OUte 1-8A1E 43-047-30173 14-20-H62-2714 g/ Ute 96138 1543' FSL &2251' FWL NESW, 34-2S-5W Altamont Duchesne ¶oßUte 2-33Z2 43-013-31111 14-20-H62-1703 gj Ute _9C140 802' FNL& 1545' FWL NWNE, 13-1S-4W Altamont Duchesne 9 a43-013-30334 14-20-H62-1703 Ç( Ute 9C140 1660' FSL & 91T FWL NWSW, 18-2S-3W Altamont Duchesne fri! /*MyrinRanch 2-18B3 43-013-31297 14-20-H62-1744,4521,4522,4554 N/A fj i UTU70814 975' FNL& 936' FEL NENE, 36-1S-4W Altamont Duchesne ¶¤92.Ute Tribal 2-22B6 43-013-31444 14-20-H62-4644 //la Ute UTU73743 1401' FSL & 1295' FWL NWSW, 15-2S-6W Altamont Duchesne UT¿l?Ute 1-15B6 43-OiŠ-Zi484 14-20-H62-4647 | ¶(/ Ute UÏU73964 1879' FNL& 1070' FEL SENE, 1-2S-4W Altamont Duchesne 146Ute 1-25A3 43-013-30370 14-20-H62-1802 †þ Ute N/A 172T FNL & 1784' FEL SWNE, 25-1S-3W Bluebell DuchesneUte 1-26A3 43-013-30348 14-20-H62-1803 ¶çýo Ute N/A 1869' FNL & 1731' FWL SENW, 26-1S-3W Bluebell

CHANGE OF OPERATOR - From ANR Production Co. To Coastal Oil & Gas Corp.
03/07/96 -- Page 3 of 4

If Indian, LOCATIONCF INELXLease Designation
, Allottee or SeWe/I Name &No. API No. & Serial Number Tribe Name CA No. Footages &Range Field County
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United States Department of the Interior

BUREAUOFLANDMANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO:
UT-922

April 11, 1996

Memorandum

TO: Superintendent, Uintah and Ouray Agency, Ft. Duchesne, Utah

FROM: Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals, BLM, Utah State Office, Salt Lake City, Utah

SUBJECT: Successor of Operator, Communitization Agreement's (CA) 96-000018, 96-
000023, 96-000035, 96-000039, 96-000040, 96-000042, 96-000043, 96-000045,
96-000046, 96-000049, 96-000054, 96-000055, 96-000056, 96-000059, 96-
000060, 96-000061, 96-000070, 96-000071, 96-000072, 96-000074, 96-000078,
96-000079, 96-000081, 96-000085, 96-000104, 9C-000126, 9C-000133, 9C-
000138, 9C-000140, UTO80l49-87C696, UT70814, UTU73743 and UTU73964,Duchesne and Uintah Counties, Utah

The enclosed Designation of Successor of Operators for CA's 96-000018, 96-000023,96-000035, 96-000039, 96-000040, 96-000042, 96-000043, 96-000045, 96-000046,96-000049, 96-000054, 96-000055, 96-000056, 96-000059, 96-000060, 96-000061,96-000070, 96-000071, 96-000072, 96-000074, 96-000078, 96-000079, 96-000081,96-000085, 96-000104, 9C-000126, 9C-000133, 9C-000138, 9C-000140, UTO80\49-87C696,UT70814, UTU73743 and UTU73964, Duchesne and Uintah Counties, Utah, have beenreviewed by this office and found to be acceptable and we recommend approval. The newoperator will be Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation. Upon approval of these Successor ofOperators, please return one copy to this office.

If you have any questions, please contact Teresa Thompson at (801) 539-4047.

Enctosures

CA 's (33)
DM - Vernal
DivisiorfOil,Gas & Mining
Agr. Sec. Chron.
Fluid Chron

United States Department of the Interior

BUREAUOFLANDMANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO:
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CA 's (33)
DM - Vernal
DivisiorfOil,Gas & Mining
Agr. Sec. Chron.
Fluid Chron



NITED STATES GOVERNMENT

memorandumDATE: AUgUSt 16, 1996
REPLY TO

ATTN OF:

Superintendent, Uintah and Ouray Agency
SUBJECT:

Designation of Successor Operator

TO:

Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

We are in receipt of the Designations of Successor Operator for our approval whereby CoastalOil & Gas Corporation was designated as the new Operator for the Communization Agreements
(CA) listed on the attached sheet, Exhibit "A".

The enclosed instruments were approved on the date of this letter. Coastal's Nationwide Bondwill be used to cover all operations, and plugging and abandonment of wells.

If you have any questions, please contact this office at (801) 722-2406, Ext. 51/52/54.

Enclosures
cc: ELisha Cordova,1Jtahßtate DOGM

Theresa Thompson, BLM/SLC

DECEllVE n
AUG2 0 1996

DIV.OFOIL,GAS& MINING

OPTIONAL FORM NO. 10
(REV. 1-80)
GSA FPMR (41 CFR) 101-11.6
5010-114

NITED STATES GOVERNMENT

memorandumDATE: AUgUSt 16, 1996
REPLY TO

ATTN OF:

Superintendent, Uintah and Ouray Agency
SUBJECT:

Designation of Successor Operator

TO:

Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

We are in receipt of the Designations of Successor Operator for our approval whereby CoastalOil & Gas Corporation was designated as the new Operator for the Communization Agreements
(CA) listed on the attached sheet, Exhibit "A".

The enclosed instruments were approved on the date of this letter. Coastal's Nationwide Bondwill be used to cover all operations, and plugging and abandonment of wells.

If you have any questions, please contact this office at (801) 722-2406, Ext. 51/52/54.

Enclosures
cc: ELisha Cordova,1Jtahßtate DOGM

Theresa Thompson, BLM/SLC

DECEllVE n
AUG2 0 1996

DIV.OFOIL,GAS& MINING

OPTIONAL FORM NO. 10
(REV. 1-80)
GSA FPMR (41 CFR) 101-11.6
5010-114



DESIGNATION OF SUCCESSOR OPERATOR

Communitization Agreement Numbers are listed on attached Exhibit "A"

Designation of successor Operator for communitized area, Counties of Uintah andDuchesne, State of Utah, being:

(See attached Exhibit "A" for description of CommunitizationAgreements)

THIS INDENTURE, dated as of the 9th day of April, 1996, by and between
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation, hereinafter designated as "First Party", and the ownersof communitized working interests, hereinafter designated as "Second Parties",

WHEREAS, under the provisions of the Act of February 25, 1920, 41 Stat. 437,30 U.S.C. Secs. 181, et seg., as amended by the Act of August 8, 1946, 60 Stat. 950, a
Communitization Agreement for the above Communitized Area, effective (see attachedExhibit "A") wherein ANR Production Company is designated as Operator of the
communitized area; and

WHEREAS said, ANR Production Company has resigned as Operator, and thedesignation of successor operator is now required pursuant to the terms thereon; and

WHEREAS the First Party has been and hereby is designated by Second Parties asOperator of the communitized area, and said First Party desires to assume all the rights,duties and obligations of Operator under the said CommunitizationAgreement.

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the premises hereinbefore set forth andthe promises hereinafter stated, the First Party hereby covenants and agrees to fulfill theduties and assume the obligations of Operator of the communitized area under and pursuantto all the terms of said CommunitizationAgreement, and the Second Parties covenants andagree that, effective upon approval of this indenture by the Chief,Branch of Fluid Minerals,Bureau of Land Management, First Party shall be granted the exclusive right and privilegeof exercising any and all rights and privileges as Operator, pursuant to the terms andconditions of said Communitization Agreement; and said Agreement being herebyincorporated hereinby referenced and made a part hereof as fully and effectively as thoughsaid Agreement were expressly set forth in this instrument.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have executed this instrument as of thedate hereinabove set forth.

FIRST PARTY
COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION

C. E. Lindberg
Vice

DESIGNATION OF SUCCESSOR OPERATOR

Communitization Agreement Numbers are listed on attached Exhibit "A"

Designation of successor Operator for communitized area, Counties of Uintah andDuchesne, State of Utah, being:

(See attached Exhibit "A" for description of CommunitizationAgreements)

THIS INDENTURE, dated as of the 9th day of April, 1996, by and between
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation, hereinafter designated as "First Party", and the ownersof communitized working interests, hereinafter designated as "Second Parties",

WHEREAS, under the provisions of the Act of February 25, 1920, 41 Stat. 437,30 U.S.C. Secs. 181, et seg., as amended by the Act of August 8, 1946, 60 Stat. 950, a
Communitization Agreement for the above Communitized Area, effective (see attachedExhibit "A") wherein ANR Production Company is designated as Operator of the
communitized area; and

WHEREAS said, ANR Production Company has resigned as Operator, and thedesignation of successor operator is now required pursuant to the terms thereon; and

WHEREAS the First Party has been and hereby is designated by Second Parties asOperator of the communitized area, and said First Party desires to assume all the rights,duties and obligations of Operator under the said CommunitizationAgreement.

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the premises hereinbefore set forth andthe promises hereinafter stated, the First Party hereby covenants and agrees to fulfill theduties and assume the obligations of Operator of the communitized area under and pursuantto all the terms of said CommunitizationAgreement, and the Second Parties covenants andagree that, effective upon approval of this indenture by the Chief,Branch of Fluid Minerals,Bureau of Land Management, First Party shall be granted the exclusive right and privilegeof exercising any and all rights and privileges as Operator, pursuant to the terms andconditions of said Communitization Agreement; and said Agreement being herebyincorporated hereinby referenced and made a part hereof as fully and effectively as thoughsaid Agreement were expressly set forth in this instrument.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have executed this instrument as of thedate hereinabove set forth.

FIRST PARTY
COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION

C. E. Lindberg
Vice



STATE OF COLORADO )

COUNTY OF nos )

. The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me on the 9th day of April, 1996by C. E. Lindberg, known to me to be the vice President of Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation,
a Delaware corporation, on behalf of said corporation.

Given under my hand and official seal of ofEce on this 9th day of April, 1996.

Notary Public in and for the State of ColoradoMy Commission Expires:

The Designation of Successor Operator is hereby approved this 16th day of August, 1996, for theCommunitization Agreements listed on the attached sheet as Exhibit "A".

Actmg Superintendent
BIA - Uintah & Ouray

STATE OF COLORADO )

COUNTY OF nos )

. The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me on the 9th day of April, 1996by C. E. Lindberg, known to me to be the vice President of Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation,
a Delaware corporation, on behalf of said corporation.

Given under my hand and official seal of ofEce on this 9th day of April, 1996.

Notary Public in and for the State of ColoradoMy Commission Expires:

The Designation of Successor Operator is hereby approved this 16th day of August, 1996, for theCommunitization Agreements listed on the attached sheet as Exhibit "A".

Actmg Superintendent
BIA - Uintah & Ouray



EXHIBlT "A"
Page 1

Communitization Agreement
EffectiveWell Name We/I Location County State Number Descrlption Acres DateEvans Ute 2-1783 NWSW, 17-2S-3W Duchesne Utah 96104 All Sec. 17-T2S-R3W 640.00 10/01/73Miles 1-35A4 SWNE, 35-1S-4W Duchesne Utah 9618 All Sec. 35-T1S-R4W 640.00 07/01/70Miles 2-35A4 NWSW, 35-1S-4W Duchesne Utah 9618 All Sec. 35-T1S-R4W 640.00 07/01/70ËBE ŠËŠW¯ii2S-4

ÒuáÍTsne Utah All Sec. 11-T2S-R4W ŠÀÕ 09ÏÕ5ÏÌÕBrotherson 2-2B4 NESW, 2-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9635 All Sec. 2-T2S-R4W 684.24 03/29/71Brotherson 1-2B4 SWNE, 2-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9635 All Sec. 2-T2S-R4W 684.24 03/29/71BroaúÏleadT-žiŠŠ NWÑË,21-2Š¾ ucÏie¯sne
9639 ÁllSec. 21 5ÀÕ 7žTiffUte ÌrÌ6alž-21B6 SESE, 21-2S-6W Duchesne Utah 9639 Sec. 21-T2S-R6W ŠÀÕÕÕ /žijilUte 1-34A4 SWNE, 34-1S-4W Duchesne Utah 9640 A\\ Sec. 34-T1S-R4W 640.00 09/03/71(Jte ŠfotÏieisori-5 Ä ÑWšW Ã1Š-ÀW ÒunÍlesne Uiah 9640 AIISec. 34-T1S-R4 ŠÀ0)Ò 05ÏÒ3ÏŽiRust 2-36A4 NESW, 36-1S-4W Duchesne Utah 9642 All Sec. 36-T1S-R4W 640.00 12/08/71Ute 1-36A4 NENE, 36-1S-4W Duchesne Utah 9642 All Sec. 36-T1S-R4W 640.00 12/08/72Babcock 1-1284 SENE, 12-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9643 All Sec. 12-T2S-R4W 640.00 02/22/72eabcock2-12BÀ ŠWŠ ÍŽ-žŠÀ 00cÍlesrie Ë.ÍiaÏ ŠŠÀŠ ÃÍ\ŠeBž ÏžŠ-ÑÀW 04Õ.Õ0 ÖžjžžjižEllsworth 2-9B4 NESW, 9-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9645 All Sec. 9-T2S-R4W 640.00 03/27/72Ellsworth 1-9B4 SENE, 9-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9645 All Sec. 9-T2S-R4W 640.00 03/27/72Burton 2-15B5 NWSW, 15-2S-5W Duchesne Utah 9646 AIISec. 15-T2S-RSW 640.00 05/30/72Ute 1-184 SENE, 1-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9649 All Sec. 1-T2S-R4W 688.00 05/15/72Ute Jenks 2-1B4 NENW, 1-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9649 All Sec. 1-T2S-R4W 688.00 05/15/72Tew 2-10BS SWSW, 10-2S-5W Duchesne Utah 9654 All Sec. 10-T2S-RSW 640.00 09/26/72Öoodrich BŠ NWSE, 2-2S 3W Duchesne Utah 9655 AIISec. 2-T2S-R3W 645.84 09/15/72Goodrich 2-2B3 NENW, 2-2S-3W Duchesne Utah 9655 All Sec. 2-T2S-R3W 645.84 09/15/72Robb 2-29B5 SESW, 29-2S-5W Duchesne Utah 9656 All Sec. 29-T2S-R5W 640.00 10/01/72Ellsworth 1-16B4 NENE, 16-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9659 All Sec. 16-T2S-R4W 640.00 10/04/72Ellsworth 2-1684 NWSW, 16-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9659 All Sec. 16-T2S-R4W 640.00 10/04/72Lake Fork 2-13B4 SWSW, 13-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9660 All Sec. 13-T2S-R4W 640.00 10/26/72Jessen 2-21A4 SESW, 21-1S-4W Duchesne Utah 9661 All Sec. 21-T1S-R4W 640.00 09/01/72Jenkins 2-1B3 SWSW, 1-2S-3W Duchesne Utah 9670 All Sec. 1-T2S-R3W 644.92 11/30/72Jenkins 1-1B3 SENW, 1-2S-3W Duchesne Utah 9670 AIISec. 1-T2S-R3W 644.92 11/30/72Birch 3-27BS SWSW, 27-2S-5W Duchesne Utah 9671 All Sec. 27-T2S-R5W 640.00 01/30/73Lazy K 2-11B3 NWNE, 11-2S-3W Duchesne Utah 9672 All Sec. 11-T2S-R3W 640.00 01/30/73Rudy 1-11B3 _ NWSE, 11-2S-3W Duchesne Utah 9672 All Sec. 11-T2S-R3W 640.00 01/30/73Brotherson 1-24B4 SWNE, 24-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9674 AIISec. 24-T2S-R4W 640.00 03/13/73Evans 2-19B3 NESW, 19-2S-3W Duchesne Utah 9678 AIISec. 19-T2S-R3W 632.66 01/22/73Evans 1-19B3 NENE, 19-2S-3W Duchesne Utah 9678 All Sec. 19-T2S-R3W 632.66 01/22/73Ute 3-12B3 'SWNW, 12-2S-3W Duchesne Utah 9679 All Sec. 12-T2S-R3W 640.00
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EXHIBIT"A"
Page 2

Communitization Agreement
EffectiveWell Name We/I Locatíon County State Number Description Acres DateJenkins 2-12B3 SENE, 12-2S-3W Duchesne Utah 9679 All Sec. 12-T2S-R3W 640.00 04/16/73Bleazard 2-2884 NESW, 28-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9681 All Sec. 28-T2S-R4W 640.00 03/15/73Üie1-2884 SWNE, 28-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9681 All Sec. 28-T2S-R4W 640.00 03/15/73Murdock 2-34BS NESW, 34-2S-5W Duchesne Utah 9685 AIISec. 34-T2S-RSW 640.00 02/12/73Ute 7 bal 10-1ŠÀ4 NWNE, 13-1S 4\Ñ Duchesne Utah 9C-126 All Sec. 13-T1S-R4W 640 00 03/10/74CR Aimes 1-23A4 SENE, 23-1S-4W Duchesne Utah 9C133 All Sec. 23-T1S-R4W 640.00 03/01/74Ute 58A1E SWNE, 8-1S-1E Uintah Utah 9C138 All Sec. 8-T1S-R1E 640.00 10/21/74Ute 55Ž2 SWSW, 33-1N-2W Duchesne Utah 9C140 All Sec. 33-T1N-R2W 640.00 08/01/75Ute Tribal 1 33Z2 SWNE, 33-1N-2W Duchesne Utah 9C140 AIISec. 33-T1N-R2W 640.00 08/01/75Ute Smith 1-30BS NESL30-2S-5W _Duchesne Utah UTO80\4987C696 All Sec. 30-T2S-R5W 609.24 06/18/81Myrin Ranch 2-1883 NWSW, 18-2S-3W Duchesne Utah UTU70814 All Sec. 18-T2S-R3W 629.70 11/05/92Ute Tribal 2-22B6 SESE, 22-2S-6W Duchesne Utah UTU73743 Sec. 22-T2S-R6W 640.00 09/06/94Ute 1-1586 NWSW, 15-216W Duchesne Utah UTU73964 AllSec. 15-T2S-T6W 640.00
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Division of Gil, Gas and Mining
OPERATORCHANGEHORKSHEET

Attach all documentation received by the division regarding this change.
Laitial each listed item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable.

Change of Operator (well sold) O Designation of Agent 5
Designation of Operator O Operator Name Change Only

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed (EFFECTIVE DATE: 12-27-95 )
TO (new operator) COASTAL OIL & GAS CORP FROM (former operator) ANR PRODUCTION CO INC(address) PO BOX 749

_ _ _ (address) Po Box 749
D_ENV_ERCO 80201-0749 DENVER CO 80201-0749

)572-1121
p ne 72-1121

account no. N 0230(B) account no. NO675

Hell(s) (attach additional page if needed)

Name:**SEE ATTACHED** API:ÛÍ Entity: Sec Twp Rng Lease Type:Name: API: Entity: Sec_ Twp Rng Lease Type:Name: API: Entity: Sec Twp Rng_ Lease Type:Name: API: Entity: Sec _ Twp _Rng Lease Type:Name: API: Entity: Sec _Twp Rng Lease Type:Name: API: Entity: Sec _Twp Rng Lease Type:Name: API: Entity: Sec _Twp Rng Lease Type:

3 ERATOR('HANGRE61 lENTATSu

dry or other leg_al documentation has been received from formeroperator (Attach to this form).(£,)/ggg

2. (Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or ther legal documentation has been received from new operator(Attach to this form). ( F-2-f

3. The Department of Commerce has been contacted if the new operator above is not currentlyoperating any wells in Utah. Is company registered with the state? (yes/no) Ifyes, show compan'y file number:

4. (For Indian and Federal Hells ONLY) The BLM has been contacted regarding this change(attach Telephone Documentation Form to this report). Make note of BLM status incomments section of this form. Management review of Federal and Indian well operatorchanges should take place prior to completion of steps 5 through 9 below.
5. Changes have been tered in the011 apd Gas nformatipn System (Hang/IBM) for each well

6. Cardex file has been updated for each well listed above.
CJ. Hell file labels have been updated for each well listed above.

i 8. Changes have been included on the monthly "Operator, Address, and Account Changes" memo
i

for distribution to State Lands and the Tax Commission. (g/pý
S 9. A folder has been set up for the Operator Change file, and a copy of this page has beenplaced there for reference during routing and processing of the original documents.

- OVER
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- OVER



OPERATOR CHANGEWORKSHEET (CONTINUED) Initial each item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable.

R615-8-7) Entity assi ments have been reviewed for all wells listed above. Wereentity changes made? (yes/ (If entity assignments were changed, attach copies ofForm 6, Entity Action FormT.

2. State Lands and the Tax Commission have been notified through normal procedures ofentity changes.

BO D VERIFICATION (Fee wells only) §as No. /JáoS3g;2-/ $$/ //n

1. (Rule R615-3-1) The new operator of any fee lease well listed above has furnished aproper bond.

2. A copy of this form has been placed in the new and former operafors' bond files.
C 3. The former operator las requested a release of liability from their bond (yes 9)Today's date /ngr< //, 19 'Î$ . If yes, division response was made by letterdated 19-· (fx Ê«»ÁN Ó¾

LEASE INTEREST OHNER NOTIFICATION RESPONSIBILITY
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Form 3 60-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(June 1999) DEPARTlV T OF THE INTERIOR I Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

BUREAU O LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993
5. Lease Designation and Serial No

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 14-20-H62-1734
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. If Indian, Alattee or Tribe Name

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" - for such proposals
Ute Indian Tribe¯¯¯

1. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE CA#9678
1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.

Oil Well Gas Well Other Evans #2-19B3
¯Ñame

of Operator 9. >API Well No.

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-013-31113
ddress and Telephone No. |10. Field and Pool, Or Exploratory Area

P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455 Altamont
ocation of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., Or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, State

1727' FWL & 1675' FSL

NESW, Section 19-T2S-R3W Duchesne Co., UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of intent Abandonment Change of Plans

Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection

Other Convert to Rod Pump Dispose Water
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally
drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and tru vertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Please see the attached chronological history for work performed on the subject well.

14. I hSerenbeyd

Title Environmental & Safety Analyst Date 03/25/98
Sheila Bremer

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY _ Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfullyto make to any department or agency of the United States any false, ficticious or fraudulent statements or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse
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COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

EVANS #2-19B3 (CONVERT TO ROD PUMP)
ALTAMONT FIELD
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH
WI: 83.29% AFE: 27594/95
TD: 12,393' PBTD: 11,660'
5"@ 12,401'
PERFS: 10,173'-I2,338'
CWC(M$): 78.4

2/21/98 LD 2½" tbg.
MIRU. ND WH,NU BOP. POOH & LD 2¾" tbg. Rel TAC @9984'. POOH & LD tbg, EOT @8873'. CC: $5577.

2/22/98 No activity.

2/23/98 RIH w/2½" tbg.
POOH & LD 2½" tbg & BHA. Tally & PU BHA (5¾" No-Go, 4' perf sub, 2½" plug, I jt 2½",4½" PBGA, 4' sub, +45 seat nipple, 7 jts 2¼", 7" TAC). PU 2¼" tbg, EOT 5855'. CC: $10,325.

2/24/98 Repairing csg.
PU 2½" tbg & RIH w/BHA, EOT 9775'. SD for rig repair. CC: $13,537.

2/25/98 Rig repair.
SD for rig repair. CC: $13,800.

2/26-27/98 SD for rig repair.

2/28/98 PU & RIH w/rods.
PU & RIH w/2½" tbg, set TAC @9965', SN @988 l'. EOT @9956', ND BOP, NU WH, PU &RIH wll¾" pump & rods, EOP @6875'.CC: $18,493.

3/1/98 On production.
PU & RIH w/rods. Fill w/43 bbis TPW, tested tbg to 700#, RD, slide rotoflex, turn to production.

CC: $53,208.
Pmpd 53 BO, 129 BW, 19 MCF, 4.0 SPM, 8 hrs.

3/2/98 Pmpd 38 BO, 293 BW, 40 MCF, 4.5 SPM, 23 hrs.

3/3/98 Pmpd 36 BO, 349 BW, 40 MCF, 4.5 SPM.

3/4/98 Pmpd 43 BO, 331 BW, 46 MCF, 4.5 SPM.

3/5/98 Pmpd 53 BO, 336 BW, 48 MCF, 4.5 SPM.

3/6/98 Pmpd 42 BO, 326 BW, 99 MCF, 4.5 SPM.

3/7/98 Pmpd 43 BO, 329 BW, 121 MCF, 4.5 SPM.

3/8/98 Pmpd 57 BO, 293 BW, 128 MCF, 4.5 SPM.
Prior prod: 25 BO, 153 BW, 46 MCF.
Final
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STATEOFUTAH FORM9

OEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
OlVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERlALNUMBER:

6 i NDIAN. ^LLOTTEE OR TRIBE N^ME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do nol use this forrn for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen exisling wells below current bottom hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO ORILL form for such proposals.

L TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER

Exhibir "A"
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT;

368 Sniith 1200 East env Vernal STATEUtahzie84078 435-789-4433
4. LOCATiON OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHlP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

AClD1ZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF 1NTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximale date work will start CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBlNG PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER D1SPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER: Name Change
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE-DIFFERENT FORMATION

12- DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dales, depths, volumes, etc.

As a result of the merger between The Coastal Corporation and a wholly owned

subsidary of El Paso Energy Corporation, the name of Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

has been changed to El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company effective March 9, 2001.

See Exhibit "A"

Bond # 400JUO708
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

NAME(PLEASEPRINT Ohn T r TITLE Vice PreSident

SIGNATURE DATE

El Paso duction Oil & Gas Compäny
NAME (PLEASE PRIt ) ÃOhn T ger

TITLE
Vice TOSident

SIGNATURE DATE
'

(This space for ate use only RECEIVED
JUN19 2001

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND
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State ofl>elatvare

Office of the Secretary of State
PAGE 1

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF

DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATTACHED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT

COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT OF "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION", CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION" TO "EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY", FILED IN

THIS OFFICE ON THE NINTH DAY OF MARCH, A.D. 2001, AT 11 O'CLOCK

A.M.

RECElvED

DMSION OF
OdLGASAND MINING

Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary of State

0610204 8100 AUTEENTICATION: 1061007

010162788 DATE:
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03/09/01 10:14 FAX 713 420 4099 CORP. LAW DEPT. 003/003

CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT

OF

CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION (the "Company"), a corporationorganized and existing under and by virtue of the General Corporation Law of the State ofDelaware, DOES HEREBY CERTIFY:

FIRST: That the Board of Directors of the Company, by the unanimouswritten consent of its members, filed with the minutes of the Board, adopted a resolutionproposing and declaring advisable the foHowing amendment to the Certincate ofIncorporation of the Company:

RESOLVED that it is deemed advisable that the Certificate ofIncorporation of this Company be amended, and that said Certificate of
Incorporation be so amended, by changing the Article thereof numbered
"FIRST." so that, as amended, said Article shall be and read as follows:

"FIRST. The name of the corporation is El Paso Production Oil & Gas
Company."

SECOND: That in lieu of a meeting and vote of stockholders, thestockholders entitled to vote have given unanimous written consent to said amendment inaccordance with the provisions of Section 228 of the General Corporation Law of theState of Delaware.

THIRD: That the aforesaid amendment was duly adopted in accordance withthe applicable provisions of Sections 242 and 228 of the General CorporationLaw of theState of Delawarc.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, said COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATIONhas caused this certificate to be signed on its behalf by a Vice Presidentand attested by anAssistant Secretary, this 9th day of March 2001

COASTALOIL& GAS CORPORATION

David L. Siddall
Vice President

Attest:

STATE OF DELAWARE
SECRETARY OF STATE

M E. R ~
DIVISION OF CORPORATIONSet oark, si tSecret«y REChlVEDooli=^":x:: 2

JUN 19 2001
DIVISIONOF

OIL, GAS AND
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET l. GLH , 4-KAS /

2. CDW / 5-LP
3. JLT 6-FILE

Enter date after each listed item is completed

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent

Operator Name Change (Only) X Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 3-09-2001

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY

Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 RM 2975B

HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995 HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995

Phone: 1-(713)-418-4635 Phone: 1-(832)-676-4721

Account NO230 Account N1845

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)

API ENTITY SEC TWN LEASE WELL WELL

NAME NO NO RNG TYPE TYPE STATUS

EVANS 2-19B3 (CA 96-78) 43-013-31113 1777 19-02S-03W FEE OW P -
HANSON 1-2B3 43-013-30629 2390 24-02S-03W FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 1-2B4 (CA 96-35) 43-013-30062 1570 02-02S-04W FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 2-2B4 (CA 96-35) 43-013-30855 8420 02-02S-04W FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 2-3B4 43-013-31008 10165 03-02S-04W FEE OW P
OMAN 2-4B4 43-013-30645 9125 04-02S-04W FEE OW P
CHRISTENSEN 3-4B4 43-013-31142 10481 04-02S-04W FEE OW S
CHANDLER 1-5B4 (CA NW-580) 43-013-30140 1685 05-02S-04W FEE OW P
CHANDLER 2-5B4 (CA NW-580) 43-013-31000 10075 05-02S-04W FEE OW P
CROOK 1-6B4 43-013-30213 1825 06-02S-04W FEE OW S
POTTER 2-6B4 43-013-31249 11038 06-02S-04W FEE OW P
FARNSWORTH 1-7B4 43-013-30097 1600 07-02S-04W FEE OW S
FARNSWORTH 2-7B4 43-013-30470 1935 07-02S-04W FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 1-8B4 43-013-30112 1655 08-02S-04W FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-8B4 43-013-30898 2418 08-02S-04W FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 1-9B4 (CA 96-45) 43-013-30118 1660 09-02S-04W FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-9B4 (CA 96-45) 43-013-31138 10460 09-02S-04W FEE OW S
BROTHERSON 1-10B4 43-013-30110 1614 10-02S-04W FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 2-10B4 43-013-30443 1615 10-02S-04W FEE OW P
BROTHERSON2-llB4 43-013-31078 1541 ll-02S-04W FEE OW P

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 06/19/2001

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 06/19/2001
3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 06/21/2001

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number:
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CROOK 1-6B4 43-013-30213 1825 06-02S-04W FEE OW S
POTTER 2-6B4 43-013-31249 11038 06-02S-04W FEE OW P
FARNSWORTH 1-7B4 43-013-30097 1600 07-02S-04W FEE OW S
FARNSWORTH 2-7B4 43-013-30470 1935 07-02S-04W FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 1-8B4 43-013-30112 1655 08-02S-04W FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-8B4 43-013-30898 2418 08-02S-04W FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 1-9B4 (CA 96-45) 43-013-30118 1660 09-02S-04W FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-9B4 (CA 96-45) 43-013-31138 10460 09-02S-04W FEE OW S
BROTHERSON 1-10B4 43-013-30110 1614 10-02S-04W FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 2-10B4 43-013-30443 1615 10-02S-04W FEE OW P
BROTHERSON2-llB4 43-013-31078 1541 ll-02S-04W FEE OW P

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 06/19/2001

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 06/19/2001
3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 06/21/2001

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number:



5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on: N/A

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: N/A

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator
for wells listed on: N/A

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,
for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 07/03/2001

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 07/03/2001

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 06/20/2001

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 07/03/2001

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed has furnished a bond: 400JUO708

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE

FILMING:
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on: > / D i

FILING:
1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:

COMMENTS: Master list of all wells involved in operator change from Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation to El Paso
Production Oil and Gas Company shall be retained in the "Operator Change

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on: N/A

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: N/A

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator
for wells listed on: N/A

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,
for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 07/03/2001

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 07/03/2001

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 06/20/2001

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 07/03/2001

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed has furnished a bond: 400JUO708

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE

FILMING:
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on: > / D i

FILING:
1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:

COMMENTS: Master list of all wells involved in operator change from Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation to El Paso
Production Oil and Gas Company shall be retained in the "Operator Change



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 EVANS 2-19B3 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43013311130000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1675 FSL 1727 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 19 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

11/7/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 El Paso plans to set CIBP and perforate additional LGR. See attached
procedure for additional information.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038

TITLE
 Sr. Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 10/5/2011

10/12/2011

Oct. 05, 2011

Sundry Number: 19164 API Well Number: 43013311130000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEEEASEDESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well EVANS 2-19B3

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP 43013311130000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 E×t ALTAMONT

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1675 FSL 1727 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 19 Township: 02.05 Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

11/7/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

El Paso plans to set CIBP and perforate additional LGR. See attached
procedure for additional information.

Approved by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: 10/12/2 1

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Sr. Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEEEASEDESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well EVANS 2-19B3

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP 43013311130000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 E×t ALTAMONT

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1675 FSL 1727 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 19 Township: 02.05 Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

11/7/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

El Paso plans to set CIBP and perforate additional LGR. See attached
procedure for additional information.

Approved by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: 10/12/2 1

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Sr. Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



Evans 2-19B3 Procedure Summary 

• POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing 

• Circulate & Clean wellbore 

• Set CIBP at 10,550’. Dump 10’ cement on plug. 

• Perforate new intervals in the Lower Green River from (9,204’-9,962’) 

• Acidize new and existing perforations with 45,000 gals of 15% HCL in three separate 
stages using retrievable bridge plugs 

• RIH w/BHA, tubing, pump, and rods 

• Clean location and resume production 

Oct. 05, 2011

Sundry Number: 19164 API Well Number: 43013311130000

Evans 2-19B3 Procedure Summary
• POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing
• Circulate & Clean wellbore
• Set CIBP at 10,550'. Dump 10' cement on plug.
• Perforate new intervals in the Lower Green River from (9,204'-9,962')
• Acidize new and existing perforations with 45,000 gals of 15% HCL in three separate

stages using retrievable bridge plugs
• RIH w/BHA, tubing, pump, and rods
• Clean location and resume

Evans 2-19B3 Procedure Summary
• POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing
• Circulate & Clean wellbore
• Set CIBP at 10,550'. Dump 10' cement on plug.
• Perforate new intervals in the Lower Green River from (9,204'-9,962')
• Acidize new and existing perforations with 45,000 gals of 15% HCL in three separate

stages using retrievable bridge plugs
• RIH w/BHA, tubing, pump, and rods
• Clean location and resume



RECEIVED: Mar. 30, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 EVANS 2-19B3 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43013311130000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1675 FSL 1727 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 19 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

3 /28 /2012

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 El Paso received verbal approval from Dennis Ingram on 03/28/2012 to
repair casing. Casing will be repaired with an expandable liner.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038

TITLE
 Principle Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 3 /30 /2012

April 04, 2012

Sundry Number: 24284 API Well Number: 43013311130000Sundry Number: 24284 API Well Number: 43013311130000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well EVANS 2-19B3

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP 43013311130000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1675 FSL 1727 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESW Section: 19 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

3/28/2012
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENTREPORT DEEPEN FRACTURETREAT NEWCONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

El Paso received verbal approval from Dennis Ingram on 03/28/2012 to Approved by the
repair casing. Casing will be repaired with an expandable liner. Utah Division of

OFI, Gas and Mining

Date: April 04, 2012

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Principle Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 3/30/2012

RECEIVED: Mar. 30,

Sundry Number: 24284 API Well Number: 43013311130000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well EVANS 2-19B3

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP 43013311130000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1675 FSL 1727 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESW Section: 19 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

3/28/2012
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENTREPORT DEEPEN FRACTURETREAT NEWCONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

El Paso received verbal approval from Dennis Ingram on 03/28/2012 to Approved by the
repair casing. Casing will be repaired with an expandable liner. Utah Division of

OFI, Gas and Mining

Date: April 04, 2012

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Principle Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 3/30/2012

RECEIVED: Mar. 30,



RECEIVED: Apr. 18, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 EVANS 2-19B3 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43013311130000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1675 FSL 1727 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 19 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

4 /9 /2012

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Please see attached for details.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038

TITLE
 Principle Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 4 /18 /2012

May 15, 2012

Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well EVANS 2-19B3

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP 43013311130000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1675 FSL 1727 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESW Section: 19 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

4 l9 / 2 0 12
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached for details. Accepted by the
utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
May 15, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Principle Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 4/18/2012

RECEIVED: Apr. 18,

Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well EVANS 2-19B3

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP 43013311130000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1675 FSL 1727 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESW Section: 19 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

4 l9 / 2 0 12
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached for details. Accepted by the
utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
May 15, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Principle Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 4/18/2012

RECEIVED: Apr. 18,



RECEIVED: Apr. 18, 2012

WESTERN

1       General

1.1       Customer Information

WESTERNCompany

Representative

Address

1.2       Well Information

EVANS 2-19B3Well

EVANS 2-19B3SiteALTAMONT FIELDProject

Event RECOMPLETE LANDPEAK/1100*, PEAK/1100*Rig Name/No.

Start Date 2/23/2012 End Date

6/29/1985Spud Date UWI 019-002-S 003-W 30

Active Datum GROUND LEVEL @6,020.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)

Afe 

No./Description

155845/44009 / EVANS UTE 2-19 B3

2       Summary

2.1       Operation Summary

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

2/24/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 RDMO 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( MOVING EQUIPMENT )

 7:30  9:30 2.00 RDMO 02 P RD @ 2-9 B3, PWOP, MOVE 16.7 MILES

 9:30 12:30 3.00 MIRU 01 P SLIDE ROTOFLEX, SPOT EQUIPMENT, RIG UP.

12:30 13:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P WORK PUMP OFF SEAT L/D P-ROD & SUBS, FLUSH TBG W/ 65 

BBLS, RESEAT & TEST TBG TO 1000 PSIG. WORK OFF SEAT.

13:30 17:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 18 P POOH W/ 112 1", 128 7/8" ( LAY DOWN 16 ) 128 3/4" L/D 24 1", 

& 2-1/2" X 1-3/4" X 36' WALS RHBC.

17:00 18:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 16 P C/O TO TBG EQ., RELEASE TAC, NU BOPE, RU WORK FLOOR & 

TBG EQ., SWIFN CSDFN CT.

2/25/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT & TGSM & JSA ( SCANNING TBG )

 7:30 15:00 7.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RU PRS SCANNING EQUIPMENT, POOH SCANNING 309 JTS 

ABOVE TAC, 10 JTS BELOW TAC, 88 YELLOW, 226 BLUE, 5 

RED. RDMOL W/ PRS.

15:00 18:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P MU 6 1/8" BIT, 7" CASING SCRAPER, TIH W/ 272 JTS EOT @ 

8520' SWIFW CSDFWE CT.

2/26/2012  6:00  6:00 24.00 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

2/27/2012  6:00  6:00 24.00 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

2/28/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( RIH W/ TBG )

 7:30  9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TSIP & CSIP AT 50 PSIG, BWD, CIH W/ 51 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE 

TBG, TAG LINET TOP @ 9995 T.M.

 9:30 13:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 323 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG, L/D 7" SCRAPER &       6 

1/8" BIT.

13:30 16:30 3.00 WLWORK 27 P MOLRU PIONEER WIRE LINE UNIT RIG UP RIH W/ 5" CIBP SET AT 

@ 10,550'. DUMP BAIL 10' CEMENT ON TOP OF CIBP.

16:30 18:30 2.00 WLWORK 21 P MAKE 2 CONSECUTIVE GUN 3-1/8" 22.7 GM CHARGES,            3 

JSP, W/120* PHASING PERFORATE 9961' TO 9686'. SWIFN, 

CSDFN CT.

2/29/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 WLWORK 28 P CT TGS & JSA ( PERFORATING )

 7:30 12:30 5.00 WLWORK 21 P CSIP @ 50 PSIG, BWD. MAKE 5 CONSECUTIVE GUN 3-1/8" 22.7 

GM CHARGES, 3 JSP, W/120* PHASING PERFORATE 9648' TO 

9197' NO PRESSURE CHANGES. RDMOL W/ PIONEER WIRE LINE 

UNIT.

 1April 17, 2012 at 10:44 am OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000

WESTERN

1 General

1.1 Customer Information

Companv WESTERN

Representative
Address

1.2 Well Information

Well EVANS 2-19B3

Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site EVANS 2-19B3

Rig Name/No. PEAK/1100*, PEAK/1100* Event RECOMPLETE LAND

Start Date 2/23/2012 End Date
Spud Date 6/29/1985 UWI 019-002-5 OO3-W30

Active Datum GROUND LEVEL @6,020.Oft (above Mean Sea Level)

Afe 155845/44009 / EVANS UTE 2-19 B3
No.lDescription

2 Summary

2.1 Operation Summary

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
2/24/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 RDMO 28 P CT TGSM & JSA (MOVING EQUIPMENT)

7:30 9:30 2.00 RDMO 02 P RD @ 2-9 B3, PWOP, MOVE 16.7 MILES
9:30 12:30 3.00 MIRU 01 P SLIDE ROTOFLEX, SPOT EQUIPMENT, RIG UP.
12:30 13:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P WORK PUMP OFF SEAT L/D P-ROD & SUBS, FLUSH TBG Wl65

BBLS, RESEAT & TEST TBG TO 1000 PSIG. WORK OFF SEAT.
13:30 17:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 18 P POOH W/ 112 1", 128 7/8" ( LAY DOWN 16 ) 128 3/4" L/D 24 1",

& 2-1/2" X 1-3/4" X 36' WALS RHBC.
17:00 18:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 16 P C/O TO TBG EQ., RELEASE TAC, NU BOPE, RU WORK FLOOR &

TBG EQ., SWIFN CSDFN CT.
2/25/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT & TGSM & JSA (SCANNING TBG )

7:30 15:00 7.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RU PRS SCANNING EQUIPMENT, POOH SCANNING 309 JTS
ABOVE TAC, 10 JTS BELOW TAC, 88 YELLOW, 226 BLUE, 5
RED. RDMOL W/ PRS.

15:00 18:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P MU 6 1/8" BIT, 7" CASING SCRAPER, TlH Wl272 JTS EOT @
8520' SWIFW CSDFWE CT.

2/26/2012 6:00 6:00 24.00 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

2/27/2012 6:00 6:00 24.00 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

2/28/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( RIH W/ TBG )
7:30 9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TSIP & CSIP AT 50 PSIG, BWD, CIH W/ 51 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE

TBG, TAG LINET TOP @ 9995 T.M.
9:30 13:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 323 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG, L/D 7" SCRAPER & 6

1/8" BIT.
13:30 16:30 3.00 WLWORK 27 P MOLRU PIONEER WIRE LINE UNIT RIG UP RIH W/ 5" CIBP SET AT

@ 10,550'. DUMP BAIL 10' CEMENT ON TOP OF CIBP.
16:30 18:30 2.00 WLWORK 21 P MAKE 2 CONSECUTIVE GUN 3-1/8" 22.7 GM CHARGES, 3

JSP, Wl12O* PHASING PERFORATE 9961' TO9686'. SWIFN,
CSDFN CT.

2/29/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WLWORK 28 P CT TGS & JSA ( PERFORATING )
7:30 12:30 5.00 WLWORK 21 P CSIP @ 50 PSIG, BWD. MAKE 5 CONSECUTIVE GUN 3-1/8" 22.7

GM CHARGES, 3 JSP, Wl12O* PHASING PERFORATE 9648' TO
9197' NO PRESSURE CHANGES. RDMOL W/ PIONEER WIRE LINE
UNIT.

April 17, 2012 at 10:44 am 1 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Apr. 18,

Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000

WESTERN

1 General

1.1 Customer Information

Companv WESTERN

Representative

Address

1.2 Well Information

Well EVANS 2-19B3

Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site EVANS 2-19B3

Rig Name/No. PEAK/1100*, PEAK/1100* Event RECOMPLETE LAND

Start Date 2/23/2012 End Date

Spud Date 6/29/1985 UWI 019-002-5 OO3-W30

Active Datum GROUND LEVEL @6,020.Oft (above Mean Sea Level)

Afe 155845/44009 / EVANS UTE 2-19 B3

No.lDescription

2 Summary

2.1 Operation Summary

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
2/24/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 RDMO 28 P CT TGSM & JSA (MOVING EQUIPMENT)

7:30 9:30 2.00 RDMO 02 P RD @ 2-9 B3, PWOP, MOVE 16.7 MILES

9:30 12:30 3.00 MIRU 01 P SLIDE ROTOFLEX, SPOT EQUIPMENT, RIG UP.

12:30 13:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P WORK PUMP OFF SEAT L/D P-ROD & SUBS, FLUSH TBG Wl65
BBLS, RESEAT & TEST TBG TO 1000 PSIG. WORK OFF SEAT.

13:30 17:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 18 P POOH W/ 112 1", 128 7/8" ( LAY DOWN 16 ) 128 3/4" L/D 24 1",
& 2-1/2" X 1-3/4" X 36' WALS RHBC.

17:00 18:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 16 P C/O TO TBG EQ., RELEASE TAC, NU BOPE, RU WORK FLOOR &
TBG EQ., SWIFN CSDFN CT.

2/25/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT & TGSM & JSA (SCANNING TBG )
7:30 15:00 7.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RU PRS SCANNING EQUIPMENT, POOH SCANNING 309 JTS

ABOVE TAC, 10 JTS BELOW TAC, 88 YELLOW, 226 BLUE, 5
RED. RDMOL W/ PRS.

15:00 18:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P MU 6 1/8" BIT, 7" CASING SCRAPER, TlH Wl272 JTS EOT @
8520' SWIFW CSDFWE CT.

2/26/2012 6:00 6:00 24.00 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

2/27/2012 6:00 6:00 24.00 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

2/28/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( RIH W/ TBG )
7:30 9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TSIP & CSIP AT 50 PSIG, BWD, CIH W/ 51 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE

TBG, TAG LINET TOP @ 9995 T.M.
9:30 13:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 323 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG, L/D 7" SCRAPER & 6

1/8" BIT.
13:30 16:30 3.00 WLWORK 27 P MOLRU PIONEER WIRE LINE UNIT RIG UP RIH W/ 5" CIBP SET AT

@ 10,550'. DUMP BAIL 10' CEMENT ON TOP OF CIBP.
16:30 18:30 2.00 WLWORK 21 P MAKE 2 CONSECUTIVE GUN 3-1/8" 22.7 GM CHARGES, 3

JSP, Wl12O* PHASING PERFORATE 9961' TO9686'. SWIFN,
CSDFN CT.

2/29/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WLWORK 28 P CT TGS & JSA ( PERFORATING )
7:30 12:30 5.00 WLWORK 21 P CSIP @ 50 PSIG, BWD. MAKE 5 CONSECUTIVE GUN 3-1/8" 22.7

GM CHARGES, 3 JSP, Wl12O* PHASING PERFORATE 9648' TO
9197' NO PRESSURE CHANGES. RDMOL W/ PIONEER WIRE LINE
UNIT.

April 17, 2012 at 10:44 am 1 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Apr. 18,



RECEIVED: Apr. 18, 2012

WESTERN

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

12:30 17:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 24 P PUMU & RIH W/ 5" WCS HD PACKER, X/O TO 2-7/8", 4 JTS, X/O 

TO 3-1/2" EUE, 185 JTS 3-1/2" P-110 WORK STRING. SWIFN EOT 

@ 5959' . CSDFN CT.

3/1/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( PICKING UP 3-1/2" TBG )

 7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 24 P TSIP & CSIP @ 50 PSIG, BWD CIH W/ 131 JTS 3-1/2" 8RD P-110 

W/S. SET PACKER @ 10,108'. MU FRAC VALVE.

10:30 16:30 6.00 STG01 35 P MOL W/ PLATINUM ACID EQ., MIX 15,000 GAL 15% HCL, RU 

PUMP LINES & EQ., PRESSURE TEST TO 9000 PSIG, PUMP 70 

BBLS ESTABLISH PUMP RATE OF 12.5 BPM @ 6500 PSIG, PUMP 

7500 GAL 15% HCL, DROP 156 BIO BALLS PUMP REMAINING 

7500 GAL 15% HCL, FLUSH W/ 105 BBLS KCL. AVE RATE 12.5 

BPM AVE PRES @ 6600, MAX RATE 14.5 BPM MAX PRES @ 

7400 PSIG. ISDP @ 3800, 5 MIN @ 1200 7 MIN VACUUM. SWI 

LET PERFS SOAK FOR 30 MIN. RDMOL W/ PLATINUM 

EQUIPMENT.

16:30 18:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 24 P RELEASE PACKER POOH W/ 128 JTS 3-1/2" 8RD P-110 EOT @ 

5061'. SWIFN CSDFN CT

3/2/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( LAYING DOWN TUBING )

 7:30 12:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 24 P COOH LAYING DOWN 188 JTS 3-1/2", X/O, 4 JTS 2-7/8", X/O 5" 

HD PACKER.

12:00 17:30 5.50 PRDHEQ 24 P PU MU & RIH W/ 7" RET PLUG, RET HEAD, 4' PUP JT, 7" PACKER, 

X/O, 316 JTS 3-1/2', SET PLG @ 9970' POOH W/ 13 JTS SET PKR 

@ 9550, INSTALL FRAC VALVE SWIFN, CSDFN CT.

3/3/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 STG02 28 P CT TGSM & JSA  ( ACID JOB )

 7:30 10:30 3.00 STG02 18 P MIX 30,000 GAL 15% HCL, RU & PRESSURE TEST PLATINUM 

ACID EQUIPMENT. PUMP 250 BBLS DOWN CASING W/ RIG PUMP 

CASING W/NOT FILL PUMP 2 BPM DURING ACID JOB.

10:30 11:30 1.00 STG02 35 P PUMP 67 BBLS KCL, BREAK DOWN FORMATION @ 12.6 BPM @ 

6800 PSIG, PUMP 7500 GAL 15% HCL, DROP 240 BIO-BALL 

PUMP 3024 GAL 15% ZONES 2 & 3 BEGIN TO COMMUNICATE. 

LOWER RATE FLUSH TBG W/ 105 BBLS.

11:30 14:30 3.00 STG02 19 P FLOW BACK 75 BBLS RELEASE PACKER. RESET PACKER @ 

9190'

14:30 15:30 1.00 STG03 35 P PUMP 24 BBLS KCL @ 11.5 BPM @ 5500, PUMP 7500 GAL 15% 

HCL DROP 276 BIOBALLS PUMP 10728 GAL 15 % HCL, FLUSH 

W/ 105 BBLS KCL. ISDP @ 2900 5/ 2700 10/ 2500 15/ 2300. 

SWIFWE

15:30 15:30 0.00 RDMOL W/ PLATINUM ACID EQUIPMENT. CSDFN CT.

3/4/2012  6:00  6:03 0.05 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

3/5/2012  6:00  6:30 0.50 P NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

3/6/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( PUMP OPERATIONS )

 7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 19 P CSIP & TSIP @ 1500 PSIG. OPEN TBG ON 20/64 CHOKE FLOWED 

BACK 172 BBLS, CSG PRESSURE DROPPED AS BD TBG.

10:30 12:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 06 P PUMP 95 BBLS 2% KCL BEGIN GETTING WATER IN RETURNS, 

CIRCULATE ADDITIONAL 20 BBLS KCL. PU ON TBG WT 15K. 

CIRCULATE WELL FULL OF BRINE WTR.

12:30 17:30 5.00 PRDHEQ 24 P LAY DOWN 85 JTS 3-1/2" TBG, ( STOP & CIRCUALTE & BULL 

HEAD BRINE WATER AS NEEDED. )

3/7/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( L/D 3-1/2" TBG )

 7:30  9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 06 P CIRCULATE WELL CLEAN, BULL HEAD 100 BBLS BRINE WATER.

 9:30 10:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 24 P L/D 15 JTS 3-1/2" TBG. 3-1/2" COLLAR LOOKING UP.

10:30 12:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P MU & RIH W/ 5-3/4" O/S DRESSED W/ 4.5 GPL, 10' PUP JT, 104 

JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG, FISH TOP @ 3200' ENGAUGE FISH, 

RELEASE PACKER.

12:30 16:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 06 P CIRCULATE WELL CLEAN.

 2April 17, 2012 at 10:44 am OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000

WESTERN

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
12:30 17:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 24 P PUMU & RIH Wl5" WCS HD PACKER, X/O TO 2-7/8", 4 JTS, X/O

TO 3-1/2" EUE, 185 JTS 3-1/2" P-110 WORK STRING. SWIFN EOT

@ 5959' . CSDFN CT.
3/1/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( PICKING UP 3-1/2" TBG )

7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 24 P TSIP & CSIP @ 50 PSIG, BWD CIH Wl131 JTS 3-1/2" 8RD P-110

WIS. SET PACKER @ 10,108'. MU FRAC VALVE.
10:30 16:30 6.00 STGO1 35 P MOL W/ PLATINUM ACID EQ., MIX 15,000 GAL 15% HCL, RU

PUMP LINES & EQ., PRESSURE TEST TO9000 PSIG, PUMP 70
BBLS ESTABLISH PUMP RATE OF 12.5 BPM @6500 PSIG, PUMP
7500 GAL 15% HCL, DROP 156 BIO BALLS PUMP REMAINING
7500 GAL 15% HCL, FLUSH Wl105 BBLS KCL. AVE RATE 12.5
BPM AVE PRES @ 6600, MAX RATE 14.5 BPM MAX PRES @
7400 PSIG. ISDP @ 3800, 5 MIN @ 1200 7 MIN VACUUM. SWI
LET PERFS SOAK FOR 30 MIN. RDMOL W/ PLATINUM
EQUIPMENT.

16:30 18:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 24 P RELEASE PACKER POOH Wl128 JTS 3-1/2" 8RD P-110 EOT @
5061'. SWIFN CSDFN CT

3/2/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( LAYING DOWN TUBING )
7:30 12:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 24 P COOH LAYING DOWN 188 JTS 3-1/2", X/O, 4 JTS 2-7/8", X/O 5"

HD PACKER.
12:00 17:30 5.50 PRDHEQ 24 P PU MU & RIH Wl7" RET PLUG, RET HEAD, 4' PUP JT, 7" PACKER,

X/O, 316 JTS 3-1/2', SET PLG @9970' POOH W/ 13 JTS SET PKR

@9550, INSTALL FRAC VALVE SWIFN, CSDFN CT.
3/3/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 STGO2 28 P CT TGSM & JSA (ACID JOB )

7:30 10:30 3.00 STGO2 18 P MIX 30,000 GAL 15% HCL, RU & PRESSURE TEST PLATINUM
ACID EQUIPMENT. PUMP 250 BBLS DOWN CASING W/ RIG PUMP
CASING WINOT FILL PUMP 2 BPM DURING ACID JOB.

10:30 11:30 1.00 STGO2 35 P PUMP 67 BBLS KCL, BREAK DOWN FORMATION @ 12.6 BPM @
6800 PSIG, PUMP 7500 GAL 15% HCL, DROP 240 BIO-BALL

PUMP 3024 GAL 15% ZONES 2 & 3 BEGIN TO COMMUNICATE.
LOWER RATE FLUSH TBG Wl105 BBLS.

11:30 14:30 3.00 STGO2 19 P FLOW BACK 75 BBLS RELEASE PACKER. RESET PACKER @
9190'

14:30 15:30 1.00 STGO3 35 P PUMP 24 BBLS KCL @ 11.5 BPM @ 5500, PUMP 7500 GAL 15%
HCL DROP 276 BIOBALLS PUMP 10728 GAL 15% HCL, FLUSH
W/ 105 BBLS KCL. ISDP @2900 5/ 2700 10/ 2500 15/ 2300.
SWIFWE

15:30 15:30 0.00 RDMOL W/ PLATINUM ACID EQUIPMENT. CSDFN CT.

3/4/2012 6:00 6:03 0.05 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

3/5/2012 6:00 6:30 0.50 P NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

3/6/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( PUMP OPERATIONS )
7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 19 P CSIP & TSIP @ 1500 PSIG. OPEN TBG ON 20/64 CHOKE FLOWED

BACK 172 BBLS, CSG PRESSURE DROPPED AS BD TBG.
10:30 12:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 06 P PUMP95 BBLS 2% KCL BEGIN GETTING WATER IN RETURNS,

CIRCULATE ADDITIONAL 20 BBLS KCL. PU ON TBG WT 15K.
CIRCULATE WELL FULL OF BRINE WTR.

12:30 17:30 5.00 PRDHEQ 24 P LAY DOWN 85 JTS 3-1/2" TBG, ( STOP & CIRCUALTE & BULL
HEAD BRINE WATER AS NEEDED. )

3/7/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( L/D 3-1/2" TBG )
7:30 9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 06 P CIRCULATE WELL CLEAN, BULL HEAD 100 BBLS BRINE WATER.
9:30 10:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 24 P L/D 15 JTS 3-1/2" TBG. 3-1/2" COLLAR LOOKING UP.
10:30 12:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P MU & RIH W/ 5-3/4" O/S DRESSED Wl4.5 GPL, 10' PUP JT, 104

JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG, FISH TOP @ 3200' ENGAUGE FISH,
RELEASE PACKER.

12:30 16:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 06 P CIRCULATE WELL CLEAN.

April 17, 2012 at 10:44 am 2 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Apr. 18,

Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000

WESTERN

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
12:30 17:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 24 P PUMU & RIH Wl5" WCS HD PACKER, X/O TO 2-7/8", 4 JTS, X/O

TO 3-1/2" EUE, 185 JTS 3-1/2" P-110 WORK STRING. SWIFN EOT

@ 5959' . CSDFN CT.
3/1/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( PICKING UP 3-1/2" TBG )

7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 24 P TSIP & CSIP @ 50 PSIG, BWD CIH Wl131 JTS 3-1/2" 8RD P-110

WIS. SET PACKER @ 10,108'. MU FRAC VALVE.
10:30 16:30 6.00 STGO1 35 P MOL W/ PLATINUM ACID EQ., MIX 15,000 GAL 15% HCL, RU

PUMP LINES & EQ., PRESSURE TEST TO9000 PSIG, PUMP 70
BBLS ESTABLISH PUMP RATE OF 12.5 BPM @6500 PSIG, PUMP
7500 GAL 15% HCL, DROP 156 BIO BALLS PUMP REMAINING
7500 GAL 15% HCL, FLUSH Wl105 BBLS KCL. AVE RATE 12.5
BPM AVE PRES @ 6600, MAX RATE 14.5 BPM MAX PRES @
7400 PSIG. ISDP @ 3800, 5 MIN @ 1200 7 MIN VACUUM. SWI
LET PERFS SOAK FOR 30 MIN. RDMOL W/ PLATINUM
EQUIPMENT.

16:30 18:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 24 P RELEASE PACKER POOH Wl128 JTS 3-1/2" 8RD P-110 EOT @
5061'. SWIFN CSDFN CT

3/2/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( LAYING DOWN TUBING )
7:30 12:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 24 P COOH LAYING DOWN 188 JTS 3-1/2", X/O, 4 JTS 2-7/8", X/O 5"

HD PACKER.
12:00 17:30 5.50 PRDHEQ 24 P PU MU & RIH Wl7" RET PLUG, RET HEAD, 4' PUP JT, 7" PACKER,

X/O, 316 JTS 3-1/2', SET PLG @9970' POOH W/ 13 JTS SET PKR

@9550, INSTALL FRAC VALVE SWIFN, CSDFN CT.
3/3/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 STGO2 28 P CT TGSM & JSA (ACID JOB )

7:30 10:30 3.00 STGO2 18 P MIX 30,000 GAL 15% HCL, RU & PRESSURE TEST PLATINUM
ACID EQUIPMENT. PUMP 250 BBLS DOWN CASING W/ RIG PUMP
CASING WINOT FILL PUMP 2 BPM DURING ACID JOB.

10:30 11:30 1.00 STGO2 35 P PUMP 67 BBLS KCL, BREAK DOWN FORMATION @ 12.6 BPM @
6800 PSIG, PUMP 7500 GAL 15% HCL, DROP 240 BIO-BALL

PUMP 3024 GAL 15% ZONES 2 & 3 BEGIN TO COMMUNICATE.
LOWER RATE FLUSH TBG Wl105 BBLS.

11:30 14:30 3.00 STGO2 19 P FLOW BACK 75 BBLS RELEASE PACKER. RESET PACKER @
9190'

14:30 15:30 1.00 STGO3 35 P PUMP 24 BBLS KCL @ 11.5 BPM @ 5500, PUMP 7500 GAL 15%
HCL DROP 276 BIOBALLS PUMP 10728 GAL 15% HCL, FLUSH
W/ 105 BBLS KCL. ISDP @2900 5/ 2700 10/ 2500 15/ 2300.
SWIFWE

15:30 15:30 0.00 RDMOL W/ PLATINUM ACID EQUIPMENT. CSDFN CT.

3/4/2012 6:00 6:03 0.05 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

3/5/2012 6:00 6:30 0.50 P NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

3/6/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( PUMP OPERATIONS )
7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 19 P CSIP & TSIP @ 1500 PSIG. OPEN TBG ON 20/64 CHOKE FLOWED

BACK 172 BBLS, CSG PRESSURE DROPPED AS BD TBG.
10:30 12:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 06 P PUMP95 BBLS 2% KCL BEGIN GETTING WATER IN RETURNS,

CIRCULATE ADDITIONAL 20 BBLS KCL. PU ON TBG WT 15K.
CIRCULATE WELL FULL OF BRINE WTR.

12:30 17:30 5.00 PRDHEQ 24 P LAY DOWN 85 JTS 3-1/2" TBG, ( STOP & CIRCUALTE & BULL
HEAD BRINE WATER AS NEEDED. )

3/7/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( L/D 3-1/2" TBG )
7:30 9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 06 P CIRCULATE WELL CLEAN, BULL HEAD 100 BBLS BRINE WATER.

9:30 10:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 24 P L/D 15 JTS 3-1/2" TBG. 3-1/2" COLLAR LOOKING UP.

10:30 12:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P MU & RIH W/ 5-3/4" O/S DRESSED Wl4.5 GPL, 10' PUP JT, 104
JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG, FISH TOP @ 3200' ENGAUGE FISH,
RELEASE PACKER.

12:30 16:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 06 P CIRCULATE WELL CLEAN.

April 17, 2012 at 10:44 am 2 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Apr. 18,



RECEIVED: Apr. 18, 2012

WESTERN

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

16:30 19:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 104 JTS 2-7/8" TBG, L/D FISH ( SPLIT COLLAR ) 

SWIFN CSDFN CT.

3/8/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( LAYING DOWN TUBING )

 7:30  9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 24 P TSIP & CSIP @ 400 PSIG, BWD, RIH W/ 24 JTS 3-1/2" ( HAD 

STOOD BACK DURING STAGE WORK ) L/D 50 JTS 3-1/2" TBG, 

BROKE HYDRAULIC HOSE REPLACE HOSE.

 9:30 11:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 06 P WELL BEGIN TO BLOW IN. CIRCULATE 300 BBLS BRINE WATER.

11:00 16:30 5.50 PRDHEQ 24 P LAY DOWN 150 JTS 3-1/2" TBG, BROKE 2ND HYDRAULIC HOSE 

REPLACE HOSE.

16:30 17:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 19 P WELL BEGIN TO BLOW IN. RU TUBING TO FLOW BACK TANK & 

SALES. DRAIN UP PUMP AND RETURN LINES. TOT FLOW BACK 

CREW

17:00 17:00 0.00 TSIP & CSIP @ 400 PSIG, BWD, RIH W/ 24 JTS 3-1/2" ( HAD 

STOOD BACK DURING STAGE WORK ) L/D 50 JTS 3-1/2" TBG, 

BROKE HYDRAULIC HOSE REPLACE HOSE. WELL BEGIN TO 

BLOW IN. CIRCULATE 300 BBLS BRINE WATER. LAY DOWN 150 

JTS 3-1/2" TBG, BROKE 2ND HYDRAULIC HOSE REPLACE 

HOSE.  WELL BEGIN TO BLOW IN. RU TUBING TO FLOW BACK 

TANK & SALES. DRAIN UP PUMP AND RETURN LINES. TOT 

FLOW BACK CREW

3/9/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( L/D 3-1/2" TBG )

 7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 24 P BWD, BULLHEAD 80 BBLS BRINE, L/D 15 JTS 3-1/2" TBG. C/O 

TO 2-7/8" TBG EQUIPMENT.

10:30 16:00 5.50 PRDHEQ 39 P MU & RIH W/ RETRIEVING HEAD, 4' PUP JT, 2 JTS, + 45 PSN, 319 

JTS 2-7/8". LATCH 0N PLUG @ 9970'. RELEASE PLUG.

16:00 18:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 27 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG, SET PLUG @ 9140'. FILL 

AND ATTEMT TO TEST CASING W/ 145 BBLS, PUMP 1.25 BPM 

@ 600 PSIG, PUMP 15 BBLS, SWIFN CSDFN CT.

18:00 18:00 0.00 BWD, BULLHEAD 80 BBLS BRINE, L/D 15 JTS 3-1/2" TBG. C/O 

TO 2-7/8" TBG EQUIPMENT.  MU & RIH W/ RETRIEVING HEAD, 4' 

PUP JT, 2 JTS, + 45 PSN, 319 JTS 2-7/8". LATCH 0N PLUG @ 

9970'. RELEASE PLUG.  POOH W/ 27 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG, 

SET PLUG @ 9140'. FILL AND ATTEMT TO TEST CASING W/ 145 

BBLS, PUMP 1.25 BPM @ 600 PSIG, PUMP 15 BBLS, SWIFN 

CSDFN CT.

3/10/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( PUMP LINES )

 7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 06 P CIRCULATE W/ RIG PUMP & HOT OILER, CIRCULATE CLEAN. 

ATTEMPT TO TEST CASING. 1.25 BPM @ 600 PSIG.

10:30 14:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 292 JTS, +45 PSN, 2 JTS RETRIEVING HEAD.

14:00 17:00 3.00 WLWORK 18 P MAKE 2 CONSECUTIVE DUMP BAILER RUNS 2.5 SX, 12' SAND 

ON TOP OF RBP @  9140'

17:00 19:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ 7" HD PACKER 2 JTS +45 PSN, 128 JTS SET PKR @ 4038' 

TEST 0 TO 4038' TO 1500 PSIG FOR 15 MINUTES, GOOD TEST. 

TEST 4038' TO 9128'. 1.25 BPM @ 600 PSIG. RELEASE PACKER 

SWIFN CSDFN CT.

3/11/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( PRESSURE TESTING CASING )

 3April 17, 2012 at 10:44 am OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000

WESTERN

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
16:30 19:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 104 JTS 2-7/8" TBG, L/D FISH (SPLIT COLLAR )

SWIFN CSDFN CT.
3/8/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( LAYING DOWN TUBING )

7:30 9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 24 P TSIP & CSIP @ 400 PSIG, BWD, RIH Wl24 JTS 3-1/2" ( HAD
STOOD BACK DURING STAGE WORK) L/D 50 JTS 3-1/2" TBG,
BROKE HYDRAULIC HOSE REPLACE HOSE.

9:30 11:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 06 P WELL BEGIN TO BLOWIN. CIRCULATE 300 BBLS BRINE WATER.
11:00 16:30 5.50 PRDHEQ 24 P LAY DOWN 150 JTS 3-1/2" TBG, BROKE 2ND HYDRAULIC HOSE

REPLACE HOSE.
16:30 17:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 19 P WELL BEGIN TO BLOWIN. RU TUBING TO FLOW BACK TANK &

SALES. DRAIN UP PUMP AND RETURN LINES. TOT FLOW BACK
CREW

17:00 17:00 0.00 TSIP & CSIP @ 400 PSIG, BWD, RIH Wl24 JTS 3-1/2" ( HAD
STOOD BACK DURING STAGE WORK) L/D 50 JTS 3-1/2" TBG,
BROKE HYDRAULIC HOSE REPLACE HOSE. WELL BEGIN TO
BLOWIN. CIRCULATE 300 BBLS BRINE WATER. LAY DOWN 150
JTS 3-1/2" TBG, BROKE 2ND HYDRAULIC HOSE REPLACE
HOSE. WELL BEGIN TO BLOWIN. RU TUBING TO FLOW BACK
TANK & SALES. DRAIN UP PUMP AND RETURN LINES. TOT
FLOW BACK CREW

3/9/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( L/D 3-1/2" TBG )
7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 24 P BWD, BULLHEAD 80 BBLS BRINE, L/D 15 JTS 3-1/2" TBG. C/O

TO 2-7/8" TBG EQUIPMENT.
10:30 16:00 5.50 PRDHEQ 39 P MU & RIH W/ RETRIEVING HEAD, 4' PUP JT, 2 JTS, + 45 PSN, 319

JTS 2-7/8". LATCH ON PLUG @9970'. RELEASE PLUG.
16:00 18:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH Wl27 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG, SET PLUG @ 9140'. FILL

AND ATTEMT TO TEST CASING Wl145 BBLS, PUMP 1.25 BPM

@600 PSIG, PUMP 15 BBLS, SWIFN CSDFN CT.
18:00 18:00 0.00 BWD, BULLHEAD 80 BBLS BRINE, L/D 15 JTS 3-1/2" TBG. C/O

TO 2-7/8" TBG EQUIPMENT. MU & RIH W/ RETRIEVING HEAD, 4'
PUP JT, 2 JTS, + 45 PSN, 319 JTS 2-7/8". LATCH ON PLUG @
9970'. RELEASE PLUG. POOH Wl27 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG,
SET PLUG @9140'. FILL AND ATTEMT TO TEST CASING Wl145
BBLS, PUMP 1.25 BPM @ 600 PSIG, PUMP15 BBLS, SWIFN
CSDFN CT.

3/10/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( PUMP LINES)
7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 06 P CIRCULATE W/ RIG PUMP & HOT OILER, CIRCULATE CLEAN.

ATTEMPT TO TEST CASING. 1.25 BPM @ 600 PSIG.
10:30 14:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH Wl292 JTS, +45 PSN, 2 JTS RETRIEVING HEAD.
14:00 17:00 3.00 WLWORK 18 P MAKE 2 CONSECUTIVE DUMP BAILER RUNS 2.5 SX, 12' SAND

ON TOP OF RBP @ 9140'
17:00 19:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH Wl7" HD PACKER 2 JTS +45 PSN, 128 JTS SET PKR @4038'

TEST 0 TO 4038' TO 1500 PSIG FOR 15 MINUTES, GOOD TEST.
TEST 4038' TO 9128'. 1.25 BPM @ 600 PSIG. RELEASE PACKER
SWIFN CSDFN CT.

3/11/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( PRESSURE TESTING CASING )

April 17, 2012 at 10:44 am 3 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Apr. 18,

Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000

WESTERN

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
16:30 19:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 104 JTS 2-7/8" TBG, L/D FISH (SPLIT COLLAR )

SWIFN CSDFN CT.
3/8/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( LAYING DOWN TUBING )

7:30 9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 24 P TSIP & CSIP @ 400 PSIG, BWD, RIH Wl24 JTS 3-1/2" ( HAD
STOOD BACK DURING STAGE WORK) L/D 50 JTS 3-1/2" TBG,
BROKE HYDRAULIC HOSE REPLACE HOSE.

9:30 11:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 06 P WELL BEGIN TO BLOWIN. CIRCULATE 300 BBLS BRINE WATER.

11:00 16:30 5.50 PRDHEQ 24 P LAY DOWN 150 JTS 3-1/2" TBG, BROKE 2ND HYDRAULIC HOSE
REPLACE HOSE.

16:30 17:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 19 P WELL BEGIN TO BLOWIN. RU TUBING TO FLOW BACK TANK &
SALES. DRAIN UP PUMP AND RETURN LINES. TOT FLOW BACK
CREW

17:00 17:00 0.00 TSIP & CSIP @ 400 PSIG, BWD, RIH Wl24 JTS 3-1/2" ( HAD
STOOD BACK DURING STAGE WORK) L/D 50 JTS 3-1/2" TBG,
BROKE HYDRAULIC HOSE REPLACE HOSE. WELL BEGIN TO
BLOWIN. CIRCULATE 300 BBLS BRINE WATER. LAY DOWN 150
JTS 3-1/2" TBG, BROKE 2ND HYDRAULIC HOSE REPLACE
HOSE. WELL BEGIN TO BLOWIN. RU TUBING TO FLOW BACK
TANK & SALES. DRAIN UP PUMP AND RETURN LINES. TOT
FLOW BACK CREW

3/9/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( L/D 3-1/2" TBG )
7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 24 P BWD, BULLHEAD 80 BBLS BRINE, L/D 15 JTS 3-1/2" TBG. C/O

TO 2-7/8" TBG EQUIPMENT.
10:30 16:00 5.50 PRDHEQ 39 P MU & RIH W/ RETRIEVING HEAD, 4' PUP JT, 2 JTS, + 45 PSN, 319

JTS 2-7/8". LATCH ON PLUG @9970'. RELEASE PLUG.
16:00 18:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH Wl27 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG, SET PLUG @ 9140'. FILL

AND ATTEMT TO TEST CASING Wl145 BBLS, PUMP 1.25 BPM

@600 PSIG, PUMP 15 BBLS, SWIFN CSDFN CT.
18:00 18:00 0.00 BWD, BULLHEAD 80 BBLS BRINE, L/D 15 JTS 3-1/2" TBG. C/O

TO 2-7/8" TBG EQUIPMENT. MU & RIH W/ RETRIEVING HEAD, 4'
PUP JT, 2 JTS, + 45 PSN, 319 JTS 2-7/8". LATCH ON PLUG @
9970'. RELEASE PLUG. POOH Wl27 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG,
SET PLUG @9140'. FILL AND ATTEMT TO TEST CASING Wl145
BBLS, PUMP 1.25 BPM @ 600 PSIG, PUMP15 BBLS, SWIFN
CSDFN CT.

3/10/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( PUMP LINES)

7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 06 P CIRCULATE W/ RIG PUMP & HOT OILER, CIRCULATE CLEAN.
ATTEMPT TO TEST CASING. 1.25 BPM @ 600 PSIG.

10:30 14:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH Wl292 JTS, +45 PSN, 2 JTS RETRIEVING HEAD.

14:00 17:00 3.00 WLWORK 18 P MAKE 2 CONSECUTIVE DUMP BAILER RUNS 2.5 SX, 12' SAND
ON TOP OF RBP @ 9140'

17:00 19:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH Wl7" HD PACKER 2 JTS +45 PSN, 128 JTS SET PKR @4038'
TEST 0 TO 4038' TO 1500 PSIG FOR 15 MINUTES, GOOD TEST.
TEST 4038' TO 9128'. 1.25 BPM @ 600 PSIG. RELEASE PACKER
SWIFN CSDFN CT.

3/11/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( PRESSURE TESTING CASING )

April 17, 2012 at 10:44 am 3 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Apr. 18,



RECEIVED: Apr. 18, 2012

WESTERN

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

 7:30 15:00 7.50 PRDHEQ 18 P TEST CASING IN SETTINGS BELOW

7522' TO PLUG GOOD TEST ABOVE NO TEST

5799' TO PLUG GOOD TEST ABOVE NO TEST

4910' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER

4850' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER

4789' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER

4038' TO SURFACE GOOD TEST, BELOW NO TEST

4417' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER

4230' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER

4167' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER

4103' TO SURFACE GOOD TEST BELOW NO TEST

4135' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER

4103' TOP OF HOLE (132 JTS IN)

5409' TO PLUG GOOD TEST ABOVE NO TEST

5521' TO PLUG GOOD TEST ABOVE NO TEST

5096' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER

5158' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER

5190' TO PLUG TEST GOOD ABOVE NO TEST (167 JTS IN )

5190' BOTTEM OF HOLE

15:00 16:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 37 JTS EOT @ 4038' SWIFWE CSDFWE CT.

3/12/2012  6:00  6:30 0.50 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

3/13/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 WLWORK 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( WIRE LINE OPERATIONS )

 7:30 12:00 4.50 WLWORK 18 P RIH W/ 60 FINGER CASING CALIPER LOGFROM 9108' TO 3830' 

E-MAIL LOGS TO SAM TISCI

12:00 18:00 6.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ RETRIEVING HEAD 1 JT +45 PSN 296 JTS 2-7/8" LAND 

TBG @ 8600'. SWIFN CSDFN CT.

3/14/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON RUNNING 

RODS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30  9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 42 P PUMP WOULD NOT STROKE. WAIT ON DIFFERENT PUMP.

 9:00 12:30 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ PUMP,128 3/4" RODS, 112 7/8" RODS & 108 7/8" RODS. 

PU POLISH ROD & HANG ROD STRING. DID NOT SEAT PUMP

12:30 14:00 1.50 RDMO 02 P RD RIG & EQUIPMENT. MOVE OFF LOCATION

3/21/2012 10:00 11:30 1.50 MIRU 28 P HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON RIGGING UP. MOVE RIG TO 

LOCATION & RIG UP

11:30 13:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 06 P FLUSH RODS W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL WTR.

13:00 16:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ RODS & PUMP, FLUSHING AS NEEDED

16:00 17:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 16 P ND WELLHEAD. NU BOP & WORK FLOOR

17:30 18:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 28 JTS 2-7/8" EUE TBG. SDFN

3/22/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON 

SUSPENDED LOADS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30 19:00 11.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 256 JTS 2-7/8" EUE TBG. MU PLUG & PKR ASSEMBLY. 

TIH & SET PLUG @ 5461'. SET PKR @ 5105'. PRESSURE TEST 

TO 1500 PSI. TESTED GOOD.  CONTINUE ISOLATING CSG 

LEAKS. FOUND CSG LEAKS @ 5030' TO 5135' & 4102' -  4233'. 

RELEAS TOOLS & TOOH TO 3910'. SDFN

3/23/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON SLIPS 

TRIPS & FALLS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30 19:30 12.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 144 JTS 2-7/8" EUE TBG. LD RBP. TIH W/ 164 JTS 

2-7/8"EUE TBG. SET PKR @ 5135'. PRESSURE TEST CSG 5135' 

TO RBP @ 9127' TO 1500 PSI . LOST 500 PSI IN 3 MINUTES. 

ISLOATE BOTTOM OF CSG LEAK TO 5318'. PRESSURE TEST 

CSG FROM 5318' TO RBP TO 1500 PSI FOR 5 MINUTES. TESTED 

GOOD. TIH TO RBP. BREAK REVERSE CIRCULATION. UNABLE 

TO CIRCULATE SAND OFF OF RBP. CIRCULATE & WORK TBG 

FOR 2 HRS. RECOVERED SMALL AMOUNT OF SAND & SCALE 

IN RETURNS. TOOH W/ 164 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. SDFN

 4April 17, 2012 at 10:44 am OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000

WESTERN

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
7:30 15:00 7.50 PRDHEQ 18 P TEST CASING IN SETTINGS BELOW

7522' TO PLUG GOOD TEST ABOVE NO TEST
5799' TO PLUG GOOD TEST ABOVE NO TEST
4910' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER
4850' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER
4789' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER
4038' TO SURFACE GOOD TEST, BELOW NO TEST
4417' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER
4230' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER
4167' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER
4103' TO SURFACE GOOD TEST BELOWNO TEST
4135' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER
4103' TOP OF HOLE (132 JTS IN)
5409' TO PLUG GOOD TEST ABOVE NO TEST
5521' TO PLUG GOOD TEST ABOVE NO TEST
5096' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER
5158' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER
5190' TO PLUG TEST GOOD ABOVE NO TEST (167 JTS IN )
5190' BOTTEM OF HOLE

15:00 16:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 37 JTS EOT @ 4038' SWIFWE CSDFWE CT.

3/12/2012 6:00 6:30 0.50 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

3/13/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WLWORK 28 P CT TGSM & JSA (WIRE LINE OPERATIONS )
7:30 12:00 4.50 WLWORK 18 P RIH W/ 60 FINGER CASING CALIPER LOGFROM 9108' TO 3830'

E-MAIL LOGS TO SAM TISCI
12:00 18:00 6.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ RETRIEVING HEAD 1 JT +45 PSN 296 JTS 2-7/8" LAND

TBG @ 8600'. SWIFN CSDFN CT.
3/14/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON RUNNING

RODS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 42 P PUMP WOULD NOT STROKE. WAIT ON DIFFERENT PUMP.
9:00 12:30 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ PUMP,128 3/4" RODS, 112 7/8" RODS & 108 7/8" RODS.

PU POLISH ROD & HANG ROD STRING. DID NOT SEAT PUMP
12:30 14:00 1.50 RDMO 02 P RD RIG & EQUIPMENT. MOVE OFF LOCATION

3/21/2012 10:00 11:30 1.50 MIRU 28 P HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON RIGGING UP. MOVE RIG TO
LOCATION & RIG UP

11:30 13:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 06 P FLUSH RODS W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL WTR.
13:00 16:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ RODS & PUMP, FLUSHING AS NEEDED
16:00 17:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 16 P ND WELLHEAD. NU BOP & WORK FLOOR
17:30 18:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH Wl28 JTS 2-7/8" EUE TBG. SDFN

3/22/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON
SUSPENDED LOADS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 19:00 11.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH Wl256 JTS 2-7/8" EUE TBG. MU PLUG & PKR ASSEMBLY.
TlH & SET PLUG @ 5461'. SET PKR @ 5105'. PRESSURE TEST
TO 1500 PSI. TESTED GOOD. CONTINUE ISOLATING CSG
LEAKS. FOUND CSG LEAKS @ 5030' TO 5135' & 4102' - 4233'.
RELEAS TOOLS & TOOH TO 3910'. SDFN

3/23/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON SLIPS
TRIPS & FALLS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 19:30 12.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH Wl144 JTS 2-7/8" EUE TBG. LD RBP. TlH Wl164 JTS
2-7/8"EUE TBG. SET PKR @ 5135'. PRESSURE TEST CSG 5135'
TO RBP @ 9127' TO 1500 PSI . LOST 500 PSI IN 3 MINUTES.
ISLOATE BOTTOM OF CSG LEAK TO 5318'. PRESSURE TEST
CSG FROM 5318' TO RBP TO 1500 PSI FOR 5 MINUTES. TESTED
GOOD. TlH TO RBP. BREAK REVERSE CIRCULATION. UNABLE
TO CIRCULATE SAND OFF OF RBP. CIRCULATE & WORK TBG
FOR 2 HRS. RECOVERED SMALL AMOUNT OF SAND & SCALE
IN RETURNS. TOOH W/ 164 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. SDFN

April 17, 2012 at 10:44 am 4 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Apr. 18,

Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000

WESTERN

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
7:30 15:00 7.50 PRDHEQ 18 P TEST CASING IN SETTINGS BELOW

7522' TO PLUG GOOD TEST ABOVE NO TEST
5799' TO PLUG GOOD TEST ABOVE NO TEST
4910' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER
4850' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER
4789' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER
4038' TO SURFACE GOOD TEST, BELOW NO TEST
4417' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER
4230' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER
4167' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER
4103' TO SURFACE GOOD TEST BELOWNO TEST
4135' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER
4103' TOP OF HOLE (132 JTS IN)
5409' TO PLUG GOOD TEST ABOVE NO TEST
5521' TO PLUG GOOD TEST ABOVE NO TEST
5096' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER
5158' COMMUNICATION AROUND PACKER
5190' TO PLUG TEST GOOD ABOVE NO TEST (167 JTS IN )
5190' BOTTEM OF HOLE

15:00 16:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 37 JTS EOT @ 4038' SWIFWE CSDFWE CT.

3/12/2012 6:00 6:30 0.50 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

3/13/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WLWORK 28 P CT TGSM & JSA (WIRE LINE OPERATIONS )
7:30 12:00 4.50 WLWORK 18 P RIH W/ 60 FINGER CASING CALIPER LOGFROM 9108' TO 3830'

E-MAIL LOGS TO SAM TISCI
12:00 18:00 6.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ RETRIEVING HEAD 1 JT +45 PSN 296 JTS 2-7/8" LAND

TBG @ 8600'. SWIFN CSDFN CT.
3/14/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON RUNNING

RODS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 42 P PUMP WOULD NOT STROKE. WAIT ON DIFFERENT PUMP.

9:00 12:30 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ PUMP,128 3/4" RODS, 112 7/8" RODS & 108 7/8" RODS.
PU POLISH ROD & HANG ROD STRING. DID NOT SEAT PUMP

12:30 14:00 1.50 RDMO 02 P RD RIG & EQUIPMENT. MOVE OFF LOCATION

3/21/2012 10:00 11:30 1.50 MIRU 28 P HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON RIGGING UP. MOVE RIG TO
LOCATION & RIG UP

11:30 13:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 06 P FLUSH RODS W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL WTR.

13:00 16:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ RODS & PUMP, FLUSHING AS NEEDED

16:00 17:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 16 P ND WELLHEAD. NU BOP & WORK FLOOR

17:30 18:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH Wl28 JTS 2-7/8" EUE TBG. SDFN

3/22/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON
SUSPENDED LOADS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 19:00 11.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH Wl256 JTS 2-7/8" EUE TBG. MU PLUG & PKR ASSEMBLY.
TlH & SET PLUG @ 5461'. SET PKR @ 5105'. PRESSURE TEST
TO 1500 PSI. TESTED GOOD. CONTINUE ISOLATING CSG
LEAKS. FOUND CSG LEAKS @ 5030' TO 5135' & 4102' - 4233'.
RELEAS TOOLS & TOOH TO 3910'. SDFN

3/23/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON SLIPS
TRIPS & FALLS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 19:30 12.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH Wl144 JTS 2-7/8" EUE TBG. LD RBP. TlH Wl164 JTS
2-7/8"EUE TBG. SET PKR @ 5135'. PRESSURE TEST CSG 5135'
TO RBP @ 9127' TO 1500 PSI . LOST 500 PSI IN 3 MINUTES.
ISLOATE BOTTOM OF CSG LEAK TO 5318'. PRESSURE TEST
CSG FROM 5318' TO RBP TO 1500 PSI FOR 5 MINUTES. TESTED
GOOD. TlH TO RBP. BREAK REVERSE CIRCULATION. UNABLE
TO CIRCULATE SAND OFF OF RBP. CIRCULATE & WORK TBG
FOR 2 HRS. RECOVERED SMALL AMOUNT OF SAND & SCALE
IN RETURNS. TOOH W/ 164 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. SDFN

April 17, 2012 at 10:44 am 4 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Apr. 18,



RECEIVED: Apr. 18, 2012

WESTERN

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

3/24/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVELTOLOCATION.HOLD SAFETYMEETING ON LOCK OUT / 

TAG OUT. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30 12:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 150 JTS  2-7/8"EUE TBG.LD PKR.TIH W/ RETRIEVING 

HEAD & 291 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG.

12:00 15:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 40 P RU POWER SWIVEL & BREAK REVERSE CIRCULATION. 

CIRCULATE 11' SAND OFF OF RBP. CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN. 

RELEASE RBP. RD POWER SWIVEL

15:00 17:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 164 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG.SDFN

3/25/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON HOUSE 

KEEPING. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30 11:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 136 JTS 2-7/8" EUE TBG. LD RBP. MU INFLATABLE 

BRIDGE PLUG & TIH W/ 273 JTS 2-7/8" EUE TBG.

11:30 12:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P SHOT FLUID LEVEL. FLUID LEVEL @ 6700'. IT WAS DETERMINED 

BY WEATHERFORD THAT FLUID LEVEL WAS TO LOW FOR 

INFLATABLE BRIDGE PLUG TO STAY IN PLACE AFTER IT WAS 

SET. INFLATABLE BRIDGE PLUG IS GOOD FOR 3200 PSI 

DIFFERENTIONAL PRESSURE

12:30 17:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ TBG & PKR. SDFN

3/26/2012  6:00  6:00 24.00 NO ACTIVETY TODAY. SHUT DOWN FOR SUNDAY

3/27/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON WIRELINE 

SAFETY. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 18 P RU WIRELINE TRUCK. RIH & SET CBP @ 8520'. RD WIRELINE 

TRUCK.

10:30 15:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TIH W/ 6-1/8" BIT, CSG SCRAPER, X-OVER & 273 JTS 2-7/8"EUE 

TBG. TAG CBP @ 8504' SLM. LD 1 JT TBG

15:00 17:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 06 P FILL CSG W/ 228 BBLS 2% KCL WTR. CIRCULATE OIL FROM 

WELL BORE

17:00 18:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 168 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. SDFN

3/28/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON USING RIG 

PUMP.

 7:30  9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 06 P CIRCULATE OIL FROM WELLBORE

 9:30 17:30 8.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ TBG & CSG SCRAPER. TIH W/ 3.22 SHOE, 90' 6" OD 

WASHPIPE, TOP BUSHING, X-OVER, 2-7/8"EUE PUP JT & 103 

JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. STACK OUT  @ 3321'. PU 40K OVER 

STRING WEIGHT TO PULL FREE. TOOH W/ TBG & WASHPIPE. 

EXAMINE SHOE. COULD SEE NO DEFFINATE MARKING ON SHOE 

FACE. ORDER & PREP TO RUN STRING MILL. SDFN

3/29/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON 

SUSPENDED LOADS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30 12:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 18 P ATTEND CONFERANCE CALL CONCERNING RUNNING STRING 

MILL. MU 6.2135 STRING MILL ASSEMBLY. COULD NOT GET 

6.2135 MILL THROUGH CSG HEAD. WAIT ON 6.125 MILL 

ASSEMBLY

12:00 18:30 6.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TIH W/ 6-1/8" OD BIT, CSG SCRAPER, BIT SUB, PONY COLLAR, 

6-1/8" OD STRING MILL, X-OVER  TO 5643'. TOOH & LD MILL 

ASSEMBLY. TIH W/  97' OF 6" WASHPIPE TO 5733'. TOOH W/ 60 

JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. SDFN

3/30/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON 

SUSPENDED LOADS & PINCH POINTS

 7:30  9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 113 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. LD WASH PIPE ASSEMBLY

 9:30 17:00 7.50 PRDHEQ 24 P MU 12 JT CSG PATCH ASSEMBLY.

17:00 20:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 24 P PU 95 JTS 2-7/8" 7.9# PH6 TBG. TALLY REMAINING 103 JTS PH6 

TBG. SDFN

3/31/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON 

OVERHEAD LOADS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30  9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 24 P PU 59 JTS 2-7/8" PH6 TBG

 5April 17, 2012 at 10:44 am OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000

WESTERN

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)

3/24/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVELTOLOCATION.HOLD SAFETYMEETING ON LOCK OUTI
TAG OUT. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 12:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 150 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG.LD PKR.TlH W/ RETRIEVING
HEAD & 291 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG.

12:00 15:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 40 P RU POWER SWIVEL & BREAK REVERSE CIRCULATION.
CIRCULATE 11' SAND OFF OF RBP. CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN.
RELEASE RBP. RD POWER SWIVEL

15:00 17:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH WI164 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG.SDFN

3/25/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON HOUSE
KEEPING. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 11:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 136 JTS 2-7/8" EUE TBG. LD RBP. MU INFLATABLE
BRIDGE PLUG & TlH W/ 273 JTS 2-7/8" EUE TBG.

11:30 12:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P SHOT FLUID LEVEL. FLUID LEVEL @ 6700'. IT WAS DETERMINED
BY WEATHERFORD THAT FLUID LEVEL WAS TO LOW FOR
INFLATABLE BRIDGE PLUG TO STAY IN PLACE AFTER IT WAS
SET. INFLATABLE BRIDGE PLUG IS GOOD FOR 3200 PSI
DIFFERENTIONAL PRESSURE

12:30 17:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH WI TBG & PKR. SDFN

3/26/2012 6:00 6:00 24.00 NO ACTIVETY TODAY. SHUT DOWN FOR SUNDAY

3/27/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON WIRELINE
SAFETY. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 18 P RU WIRELINE TRUCK. RIH & SET CBP @ 8520'. RD WIRELINE
TRUCK.

10:30 15:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TlH W/ 6-1/8" BIT, CSG SCRAPER, X-OVER & 273 JTS 2-7/8"EUE

TBG. TAG CBP @ 8504' SLM. LD 1 JT TBG
15:00 17:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 06 P FILL CSG W/ 228 BBLS 2% KCL WTR. CIRCULATE OIL FROM

WELL BORE
17:00 18:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 168 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. SDFN

3/28/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON USING RIG
PUMP.

7:30 9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 06 P CIRCULATE OIL FROM WELLBORE
9:30 17:30 8.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ TBG & CSG SCRAPER. TlH WI 3.22 SHOE, 90' 6" OD

WASHPIPE, TOP BUSHING, X-OVER, 2-7/8"EUE PUP JT & 103
JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. STACK OUT @ 3321'. PU 40K OVER
STRING WEIGHT TO PULL FREE. TOOH WI TBG & WASHPIPE.
EXAMINE SHOE. COULD SEE NO DEFFINATE MARKING ON SHOE
FACE. ORDER & PREP TO RUN STRING MILL. SDFN

3/29/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON
SUSPENDED LOADS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 12:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 18 P ATTEND CONFERANCE CALL CONCERNING RUNNING STRING
MILL. MU 6.2135 STRING MILL ASSEMBLY. COULD NOT GET
6.2135 MILL THROUGH CSG HEAD. WAIT ON 6.125 MILL
ASSEMBLY

12:00 18:30 6.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TlH W/ 6-1/8" OD BIT, CSG SCRAPER, BIT SUB, PONY COLLAR,
6-1/8" OD STRING MILL, X-OVER TO 5643'. TOOH & LD MILL
ASSEMBLY. TlH W/ 97' OF 6" WASHPIPE TO 5733'. TOOH W/ 60
JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. SDFN

3/30/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON
SUSPENDED LOADS & PINCH POINTS

7:30 9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 113 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. LD WASH PIPE ASSEMBLY
9:30 17:00 7.50 PRDHEQ 24 P MU 12 JT CSG PATCH ASSEMBLY.
17:00 20:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 24 P PU 95 JTS 2-7/8" 7.9# PH6 TBG. TALLY REMAINING 103 JTS PH6

TBG. SDFN
3/31/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON

OVERHEAD LOADS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 24 P PU 59 JTS 2-7/8" PH6 TBG

April 17, 2012 at 10:44 am 5 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Apr. 18,

Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000

WESTERN

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
3/24/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVELTOLOCATION.HOLDSAFETYMEETINGONLOCKOUTI

TAG OUT. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 12:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH Wl150 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG.LD PKR.TlH W/ RETRIEVING

HEAD & 291 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG.
12:00 15:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 40 P RU POWER SWIVEL & BREAK REVERSE CIRCULATION.

CIRCULATE 11' SAND OFF OF RBP. CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN.
RELEASE RBP. RD POWER SWIVEL

15:00 17:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 164 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG.SDFN

3/25/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON HOUSE
KEEPING. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 11:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH Wl136 JTS 2-7/8" EUE TBG. LD RBP. MU INFLATABLE
BRIDGE PLUG & TlH Wl273 JTS 2-7/8" EUE TBG.

11:30 12:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P SHOT FLUID LEVEL. FLUID LEVEL @6700'. IT WAS DETERMINED
BY WEATHERFORD THAT FLUID LEVEL WAS TO LOW FOR
INFLATABLE BRIDGE PLUG TO STAY IN PLACE AFTER IT WAS
SET. INFLATABLE BRIDGE PLUG IS GOOD FOR 3200 PSI
DIFFERENTIONAL PRESSURE

12:30 17:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH WITBG & PKR. SDFN

3/26/2012 6:00 6:00 24.00 NO ACTIVETY TODAY. SHUT DOWN FOR SUNDAY

3/27/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON WIRELINE
SAFETY. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 18 P RU WIRELINE TRUCK. RIH & SET CBP @ 8520'. RD WIRELINE
TRUCK.

10:30 15:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TlH Wl6-1/8" BIT, CSG SCRAPER, X-OVER & 273 JTS 2-7/8"EUE

TBG. TAG CBP @8504' SLM. LD 1 JT TBG
15:00 17:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 06 P FILL CSG Wl228 BBLS 2% KCL WTR. CIRCULATE OIL FROM

WELL BORE
17:00 18:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 168 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. SDFN

3/28/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON USING RIG
PUMP.

7:30 9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 06 P CIRCULATE OIL FROM WELLBORE

9:30 17:30 8.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ TBG & CSG SCRAPER. TlH W/ 3.22 SHOE, 90' 6" OD
WASHPIPE, TOP BUSHING, X-OVER, 2-7/8"EUE PUP JT & 103
JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. STACK OUT @ 3321'. PU 40K OVER
STRING WEIGHT TO PULL FREE. TOOH W/ TBG & WASHPIPE.
EXAMINE SHOE. COULD SEE NO DEFFINATE MARKING ON SHOE
FACE. ORDER & PREP TO RUN STRING MILL. SDFN

3/29/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON
SUSPENDED LOADS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 12:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 18 P ATTEND CONFERANCE CALL CONCERNING RUNNING STRING
MILL. MU 6.2135 STRING MILL ASSEMBLY. COULD NOT GET
6.2135 MILL THROUGH CSG HEAD. WAIT ON 6.125 MILL
ASSEMBLY

12:00 18:30 6.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TlH Wl6-1/8" OD BIT, CSG SCRAPER, BIT SUB, PONY COLLAR,
6-1/8" OD STRING MILL, X-OVER TO 5643'. TOOH & LD MILL
ASSEMBLY. TlH W/ 97' OF 6" WASHPIPE TO 5733'. TOOH Wl60
JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. SDFN

3/30/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON
SUSPENDED LOADS & PINCH POINTS

7:30 9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH Wl113 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. LD WASH PIPE ASSEMBLY

9:30 17:00 7.50 PRDHEQ 24 P MU 12 JT CSG PATCH ASSEMBLY.
17:00 20:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 24 P PU 95 JTS 2-7/8" 7.9# PH6 TBG. TALLY REMAINING 103 JTS PH6

TBG. SDFN
3/31/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON

OVERHEAD LOADS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 24 P PU 59 JTS 2-7/8" PH6 TBG

April 17, 2012 at 10:44 am 5 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Apr. 18,



RECEIVED: Apr. 18, 2012

WESTERN

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

 9:00 12:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 18 P SET 5.488" ID CSG PATCH 5010' TO 5512'

12:00 16:30 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/2-7/8"PH6 TBG & LD CSG PATCH SETTING ASSEMBLY

16:30 20:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TIH & SET 7" PKR @ 4284'. PRESSURE TEST 7" CSG 4284' - CBP 

@ 8520' TO 1500 PSI FOR 15 MINUTES. TESTED GOOD. 

RELEASE PKR & TOOH W/ 12 JTS 2-7/8"PH6 TBG. SDFN

4/1/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. ON TRIP HAZARDS. FILL OUT & 

REVIEW JSA

 7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 123 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG & LD PKR.

10:30 14:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 24 P PU CSG PATCH # 2

14:00 16:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TIH W/ CSG PATCH # 2

16:00 18:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 18 P SET 5.488" OD CSG PATCH # 2 4045' TO 4282'.

18:00 19:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 24 P LD 3 JTS TBG & PRESSURE TEST CSG PATCH TO 1500 PSI FOR 

30 MINUTES. TESTED GOOD. SDFN

4/2/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON LAYING 

DOWN TBG. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30 13:00 5.50 PRDHEQ 23 P LD 114 JTS 2-7/8" PH6 TBG & PATCH SETTING ASSEMBLY.

13:00 13:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TIH W/ 30 JTS 2-7/8" PH6 TBG FROM DERRICK

13:30 15:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 24 P LD 30 JTS 2-7/8"PH6 TBG. RD LAY DOWN MACHINE. SDFN

4/3/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON USING 

POWER SWIVEL. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30 14:00 6.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TIH W/ 5-1/4" OD BIT, BIT SUB & 275 JTS 2-7/8" TBG, W/ TBG 

COLLARS HITTING CSG PATCH.

14:00 16:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 10 P RU POWER SWIVEL. BREAK REVERSE CIRCULATION. DRILL 

OUT CBP SET @ 8520'. WELL WENT ON VACCUM 4 MINUTES 

INTO DRILL OUT.  CONTINUE DRILLING W/ 2K- 3K ON BIT. RD 

POWER SWIVEL

16:30 19:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TIH W/ 46 JTS 2-7/8"TBG. LT @ 9965'. TOOH W/ 21 JTS 2-7/8" 

TBG. SDFN

4/4/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING 

TBG. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30 16:30 9.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 301 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. TIH W/ 4-1/8"OD BIT, BIT SUB, 

1 JT 2-3/8"EUE TBG, SEAT NIPPLE, 19 JTS 2-3/8"EUE TBG, 

X-OVER & 300 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG.

16:30 18:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 10 P RU POWER SWIVEL. DRILL OUT 7" CBP @ LINER TOP WHILE 

PUMPING 1.5 BPM 2% KCL WTR DOWN CSG. RD POWER 

SWIVEL. TIH TO CMT ON 5" CIBP @ 10534' SLM

18:00 18:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 20 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. SDFN

4/5/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON CHANGING 

TBG COLLARS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30 11:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TIH W/ 20 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. TAG CMT @ 10534'. TOOH W/ 

114 JTS 2-7/8"EUE, PULLING SLOW AS TBG COLLARS WERE 

HANGING IN CSG PATCH

11:00 16:00 5.00 PRDHEQ 54 P REPAIR DRIVE CHAIN ON RIG

16:00 19:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 82 JTS CHANGING OUT 76 REGULAR TBG COLLARS 

W/ TAPERED TBG COLLARS. SDFN

4/6/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON CHANGING 

TBG COLLARS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30 14:30 7.00 PRDHEQ 39 P CONTINUE TOOH W/ 238 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG ( TBG PULLING 

WET, CHANGING COLLARS & SLOW THROUGH CSG PATCH), 

X-OVER, 20 JTS 2-3/8"EUE TBG, BIT SUB & BIT. TIH & FLUSH 20 

JTS 2-3/8"EUE TBG. LD 20 JTS 2-3/8"EUE TBG.

14:30 19:00 4.50 INARTLT 39 P TIH W/ 5"  TAC, X-OVER, 2-7/8"EUE SOLID PLUG, 2 JTS 

2-7/8"EUE TBG, 2-7/8"EUE PERFORATED PUP JT, 2-7/8"EUE 

SEAT NIPPLE & 158 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. FLUSH TBG W/ 30 

BBLS 2% KCL WTR. TIH W/ 110 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. SDFN

 6April 17, 2012 at 10:44 am OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000

WESTERN

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
9:00 12:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 18 P SET 5.488" ID CSG PATCH 5010' TO 5512'
12:00 16:30 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH Wl2-7/8"PH6 TBG & LD CSG PATCH SETTING ASSEMBLY
16:30 20:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TlH & SET 7" PKR @ 4284'. PRESSURE TEST 7" CSG 4284' - CBP

@8520' TO 1500 PSI FOR 15 MINUTES. TESTED GOOD.
RELEASE PKR & TOOH W/ 12 JTS 2-7/8"PH6 TBG. SDFN

4/1/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. ON TRIP HAZARDS. FILL OUT &
REVIEW JSA

7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH Wl123 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG & LD PKR.
10:30 14:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 24 P PU CSG PATCH #2
14:00 16:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TlH W/ CSG PATCH #2
16:00 18:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 18 P SET 5.488" OD CSG PATCH #2 4045' TO 4282'.
18:00 19:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 24 P LD 3 JTS TBG & PRESSURE TEST CSG PATCH TO 1500 PSI FOR

30 MINUTES. TESTED GOOD. SDFN
4/2/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON LAYING

DOWN TBG. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 13:00 5.50 PRDHEQ 23 P LD 114 JTS 2-7/8" PH6 TBG & PATCH SETTING ASSEMBLY.

13:00 13:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TlH Wl30 JTS2-7/8" PH6TBG FROM DERRICK
13:30 15:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 24 P LD 30 JTS 2-7/8"PH6 TBG. RD LAY DOWN MACHINE. SDFN

4/3/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON USING
POWER SWIVEL. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 14:00 6.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TlH Wl5-1/4" OD BIT, BIT SUB & 275 JTS 2-7/8" TBG, WITBG
COLLARS HITTING CSG PATCH.

14:00 16:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 10 P RU POWER SWIVEL. BREAK REVERSE CIRCULATION. DRILL
OUT CBP SET @ 8520'. WELL WENT ON VACCUM 4 MINUTES
INTO DRILL OUT. CONTINUE DRILLING Wl2K- 3K ON BIT. RD
POWER SWIVEL

16:30 19:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TlH Wl46 JTS 2-7/8"TBG. LT @ 9965'. TOOH Wl21 JTS 2-7/8"

TBG. SDFN
4/4/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING

TBG. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 16:30 9.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 301 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. TlH Wl4-1/8"OD BIT, BIT SUB,

1 JT 2-3/8"EUE TBG, SEAT NIPPLE, 19 JTS 2-3/8"EUE TBG,
X-OVER & 300 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG.

16:30 18:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 10 P RU POWER SWIVEL. DRILL OUT 7" CBP @ LINER TOP WHILE
PUMPING 1.5 BPM 2% KCL WTR DOWN CSG. RD POWER
SWIVEL. TlH TO CMT ON 5" CIBP @ 10534' SLM

18:00 18:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH Wl20 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. SDFN

4/5/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON CHANGING
TBG COLLARS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 11:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TlH Wl20 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. TAG CMT @ 10534'. TOOH W/
114 JTS 2-7/8"EUE, PULLING SLOWAS TBG COLLARS WERE
HANGING IN CSG PATCH

11:00 16:00 5.00 PRDHEQ 54 P REPAIR DRIVE CHAIN ON RIG
16:00 19:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH Wl82 JTS CHANGING OUT 76 REGULAR TBG COLLARS

W/ TAPERED TBG COLLARS. SDFN
4/6/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON CHANGING

TBG COLLARS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 14:30 7.00 PRDHEQ 39 P CONTINUE TOOH Wl238 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG (TBG PULLING

WET, CHANGING COLLARS & SLOW THROUGH CSG PATCH),
X-OVER, 20 JTS 2-3/8"EUE TBG, BIT SUB & BIT. TlH & FLUSH 20
JTS 2-3/8"EUE TBG. LD 20 JTS 2-3/8"EUE TBG.

14:30 19:00 4.50 INARTLT 39 P TlH Wl5" TAC, X-OVER, 2-7/8"EUE SOLID PLUG, 2 JTS
2-7/8"EUE TBG, 2-7/8"EUE PERFORATED PUP JT, 2-7/8"EUE

SEAT NIPPLE & 158 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. FLUSH TBG W/ 30
BBLS 2% KCL WTR. TlH W/ 110 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. SDFN

April 17, 2012 at 10:44 am 6 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Apr. 18,

Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000

WESTERN

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
9:00 12:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 18 P SET 5.488" ID CSG PATCH 5010' TO 5512'

12:00 16:30 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH Wl2-7/8"PH6 TBG & LD CSG PATCH SETTING ASSEMBLY

16:30 20:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TlH & SET 7" PKR @ 4284'. PRESSURE TEST 7" CSG 4284' - CBP

@8520' TO 1500 PSI FOR 15 MINUTES. TESTED GOOD.
RELEASE PKR & TOOH W/ 12 JTS 2-7/8"PH6 TBG. SDFN

4/1/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. ON TRIP HAZARDS. FILL OUT &
REVIEW JSA

7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH Wl123 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG & LD PKR.

10:30 14:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 24 P PU CSG PATCH #2

14:00 16:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TlH W/ CSG PATCH #2

16:00 18:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 18 P SET 5.488" OD CSG PATCH #2 4045' TO 4282'.

18:00 19:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 24 P LD 3 JTS TBG & PRESSURE TEST CSG PATCH TO 1500 PSI FOR
30 MINUTES. TESTED GOOD. SDFN

4/2/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON LAYING
DOWN TBG. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 13:00 5.50 PRDHEQ 23 P LD 114 JTS 2-7/8" PH6 TBG & PATCH SETTING ASSEMBLY.

13:00 13:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TlH Wl30 JTS2-7/8" PH6TBG FROM DERRICK

13:30 15:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 24 P LD 30 JTS 2-7/8"PH6 TBG. RD LAY DOWN MACHINE. SDFN

4/3/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON USING
POWER SWIVEL. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 14:00 6.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TlH Wl5-1/4" OD BIT, BIT SUB & 275 JTS 2-7/8" TBG, WITBG
COLLARS HITTING CSG PATCH.

14:00 16:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 10 P RU POWER SWIVEL. BREAK REVERSE CIRCULATION. DRILL
OUT CBP SET @ 8520'. WELL WENT ON VACCUM 4 MINUTES
INTO DRILL OUT. CONTINUE DRILLING Wl2K- 3K ON BIT. RD
POWER SWIVEL

16:30 19:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TlH Wl46 JTS 2-7/8"TBG. LT @ 9965'. TOOH Wl21 JTS 2-7/8"

TBG. SDFN
4/4/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING

TBG. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 16:30 9.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 301 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. TlH Wl4-1/8"OD BIT, BIT SUB,

1 JT 2-3/8"EUE TBG, SEAT NIPPLE, 19 JTS 2-3/8"EUE TBG,
X-OVER & 300 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG.

16:30 18:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 10 P RU POWER SWIVEL. DRILL OUT 7" CBP @ LINER TOP WHILE
PUMPING 1.5 BPM 2% KCL WTR DOWN CSG. RD POWER
SWIVEL. TlH TO CMT ON 5" CIBP @ 10534' SLM

18:00 18:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH Wl20 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. SDFN

4/5/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON CHANGING
TBG COLLARS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 11:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TlH Wl20 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. TAG CMT @ 10534'. TOOH W/
114 JTS 2-7/8"EUE, PULLING SLOWAS TBG COLLARS WERE
HANGING IN CSG PATCH

11:00 16:00 5.00 PRDHEQ 54 P REPAIR DRIVE CHAIN ON RIG

16:00 19:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH Wl82 JTS CHANGING OUT 76 REGULAR TBG COLLARS
W/ TAPERED TBG COLLARS. SDFN

4/6/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON CHANGING
TBG COLLARS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 14:30 7.00 PRDHEQ 39 P CONTINUE TOOH Wl238 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG (TBG PULLING
WET, CHANGING COLLARS & SLOW THROUGH CSG PATCH),
X-OVER, 20 JTS 2-3/8"EUE TBG, BIT SUB & BIT. TlH & FLUSH 20
JTS 2-3/8"EUE TBG. LD 20 JTS 2-3/8"EUE TBG.

14:30 19:00 4.50 INARTLT 39 P TlH Wl5" TAC, X-OVER, 2-7/8"EUE SOLID PLUG, 2 JTS
2-7/8"EUE TBG, 2-7/8"EUE PERFORATED PUP JT, 2-7/8"EUE

SEAT NIPPLE & 158 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. FLUSH TBG W/ 30
BBLS 2% KCL WTR. TlH W/ 110 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. SDFN

April 17, 2012 at 10:44 am 6 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Apr. 18,



RECEIVED: Apr. 18, 2012

WESTERN

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

4/7/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 INARTLT 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON SETTING 

TAC. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30 10:00 2.50 INARTLT 39 P RIH W/ 58 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG.

10:00 12:00 2.00 INARTLT 16 P ND BOP. SET TAC @ 10157' IN 25K TENSION. SN @ 10089'. 

LAND TBG. NU WELLHEAD

12:00 13:00 1.00 INARTLT 06 P FLUSH TBG W/ 70 BBLS 2% KCL WTR

13:00 17:00 4.00 INARTLT 39 P PU & PRIME 2-1/2" X 1-3/4" RHBC ROD PUMP W/  21' DIP TUBE. 

RIH W/ 10 1.5" WEIGHT RODS, 166 3/4" RODS, 112 7/8" RODS & 

111 1" RODS. SPACE OUT W/ 2' X 1" PONY ROD & 40' X 1-1/2" 

POLISH ROD.

17:00 18:00 1.00 INARTLT 18 P SLIDE PUMPING UNIT. PWOP

4/8/2012  6:00  6:00 24.00 SHUT DOWN FOR WEEKEND

4/9/2012  6:00  6:00 24.00 SHUT DOWN FOR WEEKEND

4/10/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 RDMO 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON SLIDING 

PUMPING UNIT. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30  8:00 0.50 RDMO 18 P SLIDE PUMPING UNIT

 8:00  9:00 1.00 RDMO 02 P RD RIG

 9:00 10:00 1.00 RDMO 18 P SLIDE PUMPING UNIT. HANG ROD STRING. PWOP

 7April 17, 2012 at 10:44 am OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000

WESTERN

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
4/7/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 INARTLT 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON SETTING

TAC. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 10:00 2.50 INARTLT 39 P RIH W/ 58 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG.

10:00 12:00 2.00 INARTLT 16 P ND BOP. SET TAC @ 10157' IN 25K TENSION. SN @ 10089'.
LAND TBG. NU WELLHEAD

12:00 13:00 1.00 INARTLT 06 P FLUSH TBG W/ 70 BBLS 2% KCL WTR
13:00 17:00 4.00 INARTLT 39 P PU & PRIME 2-1/2"X 1-3/4" RHBC ROD PUMP W/ 21' DIP TUBE.

RIH W/10 1.5" WEIGHT RODS, 166 3/4" RODS, 112 7/8" RODS &
111 1" RODS. SPACE OUT Wl2'X 1" PONY ROD & 40' X 1-1/2"

POLISH ROD.
17:00 18:00 1.00 INARTLT 18 P SLIDE PUMPING UNIT. PWOP

4/8/2012 6:00 6:00 24.00 SHUT DOWN FOR WEEKEND

4/9/2012 6:00 6:00 24.00 SHUT DOWN FOR WEEKEND

4/10/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 RDMO 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON SLIDING
PUMPING UNIT. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 8:00 0.50 RDMO 18 P SLIDE PUMPING UNIT
8:00 9:00 1.00 RDMO 02 P RD RIG
9:00 10:00 1.00 RDMO 18 P SLIDE PUMPING UNIT. HANG ROD STRING. PWOP

April 17, 2012 at 10:44 am 7 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Apr. 18,

Sundry Number: 24930 API Well Number: 43013311130000

WESTERN

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
4/7/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 INARTLT 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON SETTING

TAC. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 10:00 2.50 INARTLT 39 P RIH W/ 58 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG.

10:00 12:00 2.00 INARTLT 16 P ND BOP. SET TAC @ 10157' IN 25K TENSION. SN @ 10089'.
LAND TBG. NU WELLHEAD

12:00 13:00 1.00 INARTLT 06 P FLUSH TBG W/ 70 BBLS 2% KCL WTR

13:00 17:00 4.00 INARTLT 39 P PU & PRIME 2-1/2"X 1-3/4" RHBC ROD PUMP W/ 21' DIP TUBE.
RIH W/10 1.5" WEIGHT RODS, 166 3/4" RODS, 112 7/8" RODS &
111 1" RODS. SPACE OUT Wl2'X 1" PONY ROD & 40' X 1-1/2"

POLISH ROD.
17:00 18:00 1.00 INARTLT 18 P SLIDE PUMPING UNIT. PWOP

4/8/2012 6:00 6:00 24.00 SHUT DOWN FOR WEEKEND

4/9/2012 6:00 6:00 24.00 SHUT DOWN FOR WEEKEND

4/10/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 RDMO 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON SLIDING
PUMPING UNIT. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 8:00 0.50 RDMO 18 P SLIDE PUMPING UNIT

8:00 9:00 1.00 RDMO 02 P RD RIG

9:00 10:00 1.00 RDMO 18 P SLIDE PUMPING UNIT. HANG ROD STRING. PWOP

April 17, 2012 at 10:44 am 7 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Apr. 18,



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2012

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N3065- El Paso E&P Company, L.P. N3850- EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX. 77002 Houston, TX. 77002

Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038 Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038

CA No. Unit: N/A

LL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/25/2012
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/25/2012
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/27/2012
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 2114377-0181
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Yes
Sb. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: N/A
Sc. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 6/25/2012
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM N/A BIA Not Received
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: N/A
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: Second Oper Chg
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/29/2012
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/29/2012
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/29/:2012
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: N/A
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JUO705
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 6/29/2012
COMMENTS:
Disposal and Injections wells willbe moved when UIC 5 is received.

El Paso.xis

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2012

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N3065- El Paso E&P Company, L.P. N3850- EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX. 77002 Houston, TX. 77002

Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038 Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038

CA No. Unit: N/A

LL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/25/2012
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/25/2012
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/27/2012
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 2114377-0181
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Yes
Sb. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: N/A
Sc. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 6/25/2012
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM N/A BIA Not Received
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: N/A
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: Second Oper Chg
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/29/2012
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/29/2012
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/29/:2012
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: N/A
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JUO705
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 6/29/2012
COMMENTS:
Disposal and Injections wells willbe moved when UIC 5 is received.

El Paso.xis



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

Multiple Leases
6 IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do notuse thisform for proposals to drillnewwells,significantlydeepen existingwells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, orto
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER See Attached

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

El Paso E&P Company, L.P. Attn: Maria Gomez
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1001 Louisiana ciTY Houston STATE TX ZIP 77002 (713) 997-5038 See Attached
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See Attached COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

« CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACl( WATER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOr10inalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUC1NG FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Change of
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Name/Operator

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please be advised that El Paso E&P Company, L.P. (current Operator) has changed names to EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
(new Operator) effective June 1, 2012 and that EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is considered the new operator of the attached
well locations.

EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is responsible under the termsand conditionsof the lease(s) for the operations conducted
upon leased lands. Bond coverage is provided by the State of Utah Statewide Blanket Bond No. 400JUO705, Bureau of Land
Management Nationwide Bond No. 103601420, and Bureau of Indian Affairs Nationwide Bond No. 103601473.

Frank W. Fallerr Frank W. Falleri
Vice President Sr. Vice President
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.

NAME(PLEAS NT) Maria S. Gomez TITLE Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE

E

DATE 6/22/2012

(ThisspaceforStateuseonly) RECEIVED
D JUN2 5 2012

. . . _ gee instrucuans on Reverse sd•) Olv.0F OIL,GAS&MINING"°°bivision of Oil,Gasand Mining-
Earlenekussell, Engineering Techniclaa

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

Multiple Leases
6 IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do notuse thisform for proposals to drillnewwells,significantlydeepen existingwells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, orto
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER See Attached

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

El Paso E&P Company, L.P. Attn: Maria Gomez
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1001 Louisiana ciTY Houston STATE TX ZIP 77002 (713) 997-5038 See Attached
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See Attached COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

« CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACl( WATER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOr10inalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUC1NG FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Change of
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Name/Operator

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please be advised that El Paso E&P Company, L.P. (current Operator) has changed names to EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
(new Operator) effective June 1, 2012 and that EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is considered the new operator of the attached
well locations.

EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is responsible under the termsand conditionsof the lease(s) for the operations conducted
upon leased lands. Bond coverage is provided by the State of Utah Statewide Blanket Bond No. 400JUO705, Bureau of Land
Management Nationwide Bond No. 103601420, and Bureau of Indian Affairs Nationwide Bond No. 103601473.
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El Paso E1 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E1 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

Well Well
Well Name Sec TWP RNG API Number Entity Lease Type Type Status Conf
DVVR3-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301350070 14204621118 OVV APD C
LAKEWOOD ESTATES 3-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301350127 1420H621328 OW APD C
YOUNG3-15A3 15 010S 030W 4301350122 FEE OW APD C
WHITING4-1A2 01 010S 020W 4301350424 Fee OW APD C
ELFUMSO4-34A4 34 010S 040VV 4301350720 Fee OVV APD C
YOUNG 2-281 02 020S 010W 4304751180 FEE OW APD C
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-1084 10 020S 040W 4301350712 18221 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-2684 26 020S 040W 4301350714 18432 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-24B4 24 020S 040W 4301350717 18315 Fee OW DRL C
Cook4-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301351162 18449 Fee OVV DRL C
Peterson4-22C6 22 030S 060VV 4301351163 18518 Fee OVV DRL C
LakeForkRanch4-14B4 14 020S 040VV 4301351240 99999 Fee 04V DRL C
Ahelesco4-20C6 20 030S 060VV 4301351241 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Peck3-13BS 13 020S 050VV 4301351364 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Jensen2-9C4 09 030S 040VV 4301351375 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
El Paso 3-5C4 05 030S 040W 4301351376 18563 Fee OW DRL C
ULT6-31 31 030S 020E 4304740033 FEE O\¾ LA
OBERHANSLY 2-2A1 02 010S 010W 4304740164 FEE OW LA
DWR 3-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301351433 14-20-H62-4724 OW NEW C
LakeForkRanch5-23B4 23 0208 040VV 4301360739 Fee CNV NEVV
DuchesneLand4-10C5 10 030S 050VV 4301351262 Fee OVV NEVV C
Cabinland 4-9B3 09 020S 030W 4301351374 Fee OW NEW C
Layton 4-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301351389 Fee OW NEW C
Golinski4-24BS 24 020S 050VV 4301351404 Fee OiN NE\N C
AII>a1-21C4 21 030S 040VV 4301351460 Fee 04V NEVV C
Allison4-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301351466 Fee ONV NEVV C
Seeley 4-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301351486 Fee OW NEW C
Allen4-25B5 25 020S 050VV 4301351487 Fee OVV NEVV C
Hewett 2-6C4 06 030S 040W 4301351489 Fee OW NEW C
Young2-7C4 07 030S 040VV 4301351500 Fee OVV NEVV C
Brighton 3-31A1E 31 010S 010E 4304752471 Fee OW NEW C
Hamaker3-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304752491 Fee OVV NEVV C
Bolton3-29A1E 29 010S 010E 4304752871 Fee OVV NEVV C
HORROCKS5-20A1 20 010S 010W 4301334280 17378 FEE OW OPS C
DWR 3-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301334263 17440 14-20-462-1120 OW P
DWR 3-22C6 22 030S 060W 4301334106 17298 14-20-462-1131 OW P
DWR 3-28C6 28 030S 060W 4301334264 17360 14-20-462-1323 OW P
UTE 1-7A2 07 010S 020W 4301330025 5850 14-20-462-811 OW
UTE2-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301331033 10115 14-20-H62-1118 OiN P
WLRTRIBAL2-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301331035 10250 14-20-H62-1120 OW P
CEDAR RIM 10-A-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330615 6420 14-20-H62-1128 OW P
CEDAR RIM 12A B 030S 060W 4301331173 10672 14-20-H62-1323 OW P
UTE-FEE 2-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301331123 10365 14-20-H62-1328 OW P
TAYLOR3-34C6 34 030S 060VV 4301350200 17572 1420H621329 CNV P
BAKER UTE 2-34C6 34 030S 060W 4301332634 14590 14-20-H62-1329 OW P
UTE 3-35Z2 K 35 010N 020W 4301331133 10483 14-20-H62-1614 OW P
UTE 1-32Z2 32 010N 020W 4301330379 1915 14-20-H62-1702 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-33D 33 010N 020W 4301330334 1851 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTE 2-33Z2 33 010N 020W 4301331111 10451 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTETRIBAL2-34Z2 010N 020W 4301331167 10668 14-20-H62-1704 OW
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-13B4 13 020S 040W 4301334262 17439 14-20-H62-1743 OW P
Üii 1-28B4 28 020S 040VV 4301330242 1796 14-20-H62-1745 OVV P
UTE 1-34A4 34 010S 040W 4301330076 1585 14-20-H62-1774 OW P
UTE 1-36A4 36 010S 040VV 4301330069 1580 14-20-H62-1793 (MN P
UTE 1-1B4 01 020S 040W 4301330129 1700 14-20-H62-1798 OW P
UTE 1-31A2 31 010S 020VV 4301330401 1925 14-20-H62-1801 (MN P |

El Paso E1 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E1 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012
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El Paso E2 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E2 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE1-25A3 25 010S 030VV4301330370 1920 'Wi-20-H62-1802 OVV P
UTE 2-25A3 25 010S 030W 4301331343 11361 14-20-H62-1802 OW P
UTE 1-26A3 26 OS 030W 4301330348 1890 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTE 2-26A3 26 010S 030W 4301331340 11349 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTETRIBAL4-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301350274 18009 1420H621804 OVV P C
UTE 2-35A3 35 010S 030W 4301331292 11222 14-20-H62-1804 ÖW P
UTE3-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301331365 11454 14-20-H62-1804 OIVV P
UTE 145B2 06 0208: 020VV4301330349 1895 14-20-H62-1807 O\N P
UTE 2-6B2 06 020S 020W 4301331140 11190 14-20-H62-1807 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-682 06 020S 020W 4301350273 18008 14-20-H62-1807 OW P C
POWELL 4-19A1 19 010S 010W 4301330071 8302 14-20-H62-1847 OW P
COLTHARP 1-27Z1 27 010N 010W 4301330151 4700 14-20-H62-1933 OW P
UTE 1-8A1E 08 010S 010E 4304730173 1846 14-20-H62-2147 OW P
UTETRIBE 1-31 31 010N 020VV 4301330278 4755 14-20-H62-2.421 OVV P
UTE 1-28B6X 28 020S 060W 4301330510 11165 14-20-H62-2492 OW P
RINKER 2-21B5 21 020S 050W 4301334166 17299 14-20-H62-2508 OW P
MURDOCK 2-34B5 34 020S 050W 4301331132 10456 14-20-H62-2511 OW P
LffE 1-3586 [35 0206; 060VV4301330507 2335 14-20-H62-2531 O\N P
UTE TRIBAL1-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304730829 860 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE 2-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304737831 16709 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE TRIBAL1-27A1E \27 010S 010E 4304730421 800 14-20-H62-2662 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-35A1E 35 010S 010E 4304730286 795 14-20-H62-2665 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-15A1E 15 010S 010E 4304730820 850 14-20-H62-2717 OW P
UTE TRIBAL P-3B1E 03 02 S 010E 4304730190 4536 14-20-H62-2873 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-22ATE 22 010S 010E 4304730429 810 14-20-H62-3103 OW P
BHUTE1-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301330419 10705 14-20-H62-3436 09/ P
BHUTE2-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301332790 15802 14-20-H62-3436 OV/ P
MCFARLANE 1-4D6 04 040S 060W 4301331074 10325 14-20-H62-3452 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-11D6 11 040S 060W 4301330482 6415 14-20-H62-3454 OW P
CARSON 2-36A1 36 010S 010W 4304731407 737 14-20-H62-3806 OW P
UTE 2-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301330775 9133 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
DWR 3-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301334003 17092 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
THE PERFECT "10" 1-10A1 10 010S 010W 4301330935 9461 14-20-H62-3855 OW
BADGER-SAM HU MONGUS1-15A1 15 010S 010W 4301330949 9462 14-20-H62-3860 OW P
MAXIMILLIAN-UTE14-1 14 010S 030W 4301330726 8437 14-20-H62-3868 OW P
FRED BASSETT 1-22A1 22 010S 010W 4301330781 9460 14-20-H62-3880 OW
UTETRIBAL1-30Z1 30 010N 010VV 4301330813 9405 14-20-H62-3910 OVV P
UTE LB 1-13A3 13 010S 030W 4301330894 9402 14-20-H62-3980 OW P
UTE2-22B6 22 020S 060VV 4301331444 11641 14-20-H62-4614 OVV P
UINTA QURAY 1-1A3 01 010S 030W 4301330132 5540 14-20-H62-4664 OW P
UTE 1-6D6 06 040S 060W 4301331696 12058 14-20-H62-4752 0W
UTE2-11D6 11 040S 060VV 4301350179 17667 1420H624801 OVV P
LÏÑï1-15D6 15 040S 060VV 4301330429 10958 14-20-H62-4824 OVV P
UTE2-15D6 15 040S 060W 4301334026 17193 14-20-H624824 OW
HILL3-24C6 24 030S 060VV 4301350293 18020 1420H624866 OVV P C
BARCLAYUTE 2-24C6R 24 030S 060W 4301333730 16385 14-20-H62-4866 OW P
BROTHERSON 1-2B4 |02 020S 040W 4301330062 1570 FEE OW P
BOREN 1-24A2 24 010S 020W 4301330084 5740 FEE _ 0W
FARNSWORTH 1-13BS 13 020S 050W 4301330092 1610 FEE OW P
BROADHEAD 1-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301330100 1595 FEE OW P
ASAYEJ 1-20A1 20 010S 010VV 4301330102 8304 FEE OVV P
HANSONTRUST 1-5B3 05 020S 030W 4301330109 1635 FEE OW P
ELLSO/ORTH1-8B4 08 020S 040VV 4301330112 1655 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-9B4 09 020S 040VV 4301330118 1660 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-17B4 17 020S 040VV 4301330126 1695 FEE OVV P
CHANDLER1-5B4 05 020S 040VV 4301330140 1685 FEE OVV P
HANSON1-32A3 32 010S 030VV 4301330141 1640 FEE OVV P
JESSEN 1-17A4 17 010S 040VV 4301330173 4725 FEE OVV P

El Paso E2 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E2 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012
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OBERHANSLY2-31Z1 31 010N 010VV 4301330970 9262 FEE Ï>Al I¾\
MORRIS2-TA3 07 010S 030VV 4301330977 9725 FEE ONV PA
POVVELL2-08A3 08 010S 030VV4301330979 10175 FEE OVV PA
FISHER24A3 06 010S 030VV 4301330984 10110 FEE OVV PA
JACOBSEN2-12A4 2 010S 040VV 4301330985 10480 FEE OVV PA
CHENEY2-33/G 33 010S 020VV 4301331042 10313 FEE OVV PA
HANSON TRUST 2-29A3 29 010S 030W 4301331043 5306 FEE OW PA
BURTON2-15B5 15 020S 050VV 4301331044 10205 FEE OVV PA
ËÃh4NS-UTE2-1783 17 020S 030VV 4301331056 10210 FEE LDVV PA
ELLSVVORTH2-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301331090 5336 FEE 04V !%4
REMINGTON 2-34A3 34 010S 030W 4301331091 1902 FEE OW PA
VVINKLER2-28A3 28 010S 030VV 4301331109 4519 FEE O\¾ PA
TEVV2-10B5 10 020S 050VV 4301331125 1751 FEE ONV PA
LIND6WAY2-33A4 33 010S 040VV 4301331141 1756 FEE OVV PA
FIELDSTED2-28A4 28 010S 040VV 4301331293 10665 FEE OVV PA
POWELL 4-13A2 13 010S 020W 4301331336 11177 FEE GW PA
DUMP2-20A3 20 010S 030W 4301331505 11691 FEE OW PA
SMITH2X-23C7 23 0308 070VV 4301331634 12382 FEE D PA
MORTENSEN 3-32A2 32 010S 020W 4301331872 11928 FEE OW PA
TODDUSA ST 1-2B1 02 020S 010W 4304730167 99998 FEE OW PA
STATE1-7B1E 07 020S 010E 4304730180 5555 FEE OW
BACON1-10B1E 10 020S 010E 4304730881 5550 FEE ONV PA
PARIETTEDRAW 28-44 28 040S 010E 4304731408 4537 FEE OW PA
REYNOLDS2-7B1E 07 020S 010E 4304731840 4960 FEE OW PA
STATE2-35A2 35 010S 020W 4301330156 4715 ML-22874 OW PA
UTAH STATE LB 1-11B1 11 020S 010W 4304730171 5530 ML-23655 OW PA
STATE1-8A3 08 010S 030W 4301330286 5655 ML-24316 OW A
UTAHFEDERAL1-24B1 24 020S 010W 4304730220 590 ML-26079 OW PA
CEDAR RIM 15 34 030S 060W 4301330383 6395 14-20-462- 29 OW S

El Paso E7 Company, LP. (N3065) to EP Energy E7 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

TIh&DTHY1-09A3 09 010S 030VV 4301330321 10883 FEE 04V PA
BARRETT 1-34A5 34 010S 050W 4301330323 9115 FEE OW PA
MEAGHER TRIBAL 1-9B2 09 020S 020W 4301330325 9121 FEE OW PA
PHILLIPSUTE 1-3C5 03 030S 050W 4301330333 1816 FEE OW PA
ELLSWIORTH1-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301330351 6375 FEE ONV PA
LAVVSC‡J1-28A1 28 010S 010VV 4301330358 5915 FEE OVV PA
An ES1-23A4 23 010S 040VV 4301330375 1901 FEE OVV PA
HORROCKS1-6A1 06 010S 010W 4301330390 5675 FEE OW PA
SHRINE HOSPITAL 1-10C5 10 0308 050W 4301330393 5565 FEE OW Pi
GOODRICH 1-1882 18 020S 020VV 4301330397 5485 FEE O\N PA
SVVDPOVVELL3 13 010S 020VV 4301330478 10708 FEE VVD PA
BODRERO1-15B3 15 020S 030W 4301330565 4534 FEE OW
AkOC‡4TRIBAL1-30C4 30 030S 040VV 4301330576 2360 FEE ONV PA
DUNCAN2-9B5 09 020S 050VV 4301330719 5440 FEE ONV PA
FISHER1-16A4 16 010S 040VV 4301330737 2410 FEE ONV PA
URRUTY2-34A2 34 010S 020VV 4301330753 9117 FEE ONV PA
GiOODRICH1-24A4 24 010S 040VV 4301330760 2415 FEE 04V PA
CARLSMITH2-25A4 25 0108 040VV 4301330776 9136 FEE 04V PA
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JACOBSEN2-12A4 2 010S 040VV 4301330985 10480 FEE OVV PA
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HANSON TRUST 2-29A3 29 010S 030W 4301331043 5306 FEE OW PA
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ELLSVVORTH2-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301331090 5336 FEE 04V !%4
REMINGTON 2-34A3 34 010S 030W 4301331091 1902 FEE OW PA
VVINKLER2-28A3 28 010S 030VV 4301331109 4519 FEE O\¾ PA
TEVV2-10B5 10 020S 050VV 4301331125 1751 FEE ONV PA
LIND6WAY2-33A4 33 010S 040VV 4301331141 1756 FEE OVV PA
FIELDSTED2-28A4 28 010S 040VV 4301331293 10665 FEE OVV PA
POWELL 4-13A2 13 010S 020W 4301331336 11177 FEE GW PA
DUMP2-20A3 20 010S 030W 4301331505 11691 FEE OW PA
SMITH2X-23C7 23 0308 070VV 4301331634 12382 FEE D PA
MORTENSEN 3-32A2 32 010S 020W 4301331872 11928 FEE OW PA
TODDUSA ST 1-2B1 02 020S 010W 4304730167 99998 FEE OW PA
STATE1-7B1E 07 020S 010E 4304730180 5555 FEE OW
BACON1-10B1E 10 020S 010E 4304730881 5550 FEE ONV PA
PARIETTEDRAW 28-44 28 040S 010E 4304731408 4537 FEE OW PA
REYNOLDS2-7B1E 07 020S 010E 4304731840 4960 FEE OW PA
STATE2-35A2 35 010S 020W 4301330156 4715 ML-22874 OW PA
UTAH STATE LB 1-11B1 11 020S 010W 4304730171 5530 ML-23655 OW PA
STATE1-8A3 08 010S 030W 4301330286 5655 ML-24316 OW A
UTAHFEDERAL1-24B1 24 020S 010W 4304730220 590 ML-26079 OW PA
CEDAR RIM 15 34 030S 060W 4301330383 6395 14-20-462- 29 OW S



El Paso E8 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E8 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE TRIBAL2-24C7 24 030S 070W 4301331028 10240 14-20-H62-1135 OW S
CEDARRIM12 28 030S 060W 4301330344 6370 14-20-H62-1323 OW IS
CEDARRIM16 33 030S 060W 4301330363 6390 14-20-H62-1328 OW S
SPRING HOLLOW 2-34Z3 34 010N 030W 4301330234 5255 14-20-H62-1480 OW S
E3/ANSUTE1-17B3 17 020S 030VV 4301330274 5335 14-20-H62-1733 OVV S
UTE JENKS 2-1-B4 G 01 020S 040W 4301331197 10844 14-20-H62-1782 OW S
LffE3-12B3 12 020S 030VV 4301331379 11490 14-20-H62-1810 OVV S
UTE TRIBAL9-4B1 04 020S 010W 4301330194 5715 14-20-H62-1969 OW S
UTE TRIBAL 2-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301331424 11615 14-20-H62-2489 OW S
UTE 1-33B6 33 020S 060W 4301330441 1230 14-20-H62-2493 OW S
UTE2-22B5 22 0206; 050VV 4301331122 10453 14-:20-H62-2509 O\N S
UTE1-1881E 18 020S 010E 4304730969 9135 14-20-H62-2864 O\¾ S
LAUREN UTE 1-23A3 23 010S 030W 4301330895 9403 14-20-H62-3981 OW S
UTE 2-28B6 28 020S 060W 4301331434 116i4 14-20-H62-4622 OW S
UTE 1-27B6X 27 020S 060W 4301330517 11166 14-20-H62-4631 OW S
UTE2-27B6 27 020S 060VV 4301331449 11660 14-20-H62-4:331 ONV S
CEDAR RIM10-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330328 6365 14-20-H62-4724 OW 5
UTE 5-30A2 30 010S 020W 4301330169 5910 14-20-H62-4863 OW S
UTE TRIBAL G-1 (1-24C6) 24 030S 060W 4301330298 4533 14-20-H62-4866 OW S
UTE TRIBAL FEDERAL 1-30C5 30 030S 050W 4301330475 665 14-20-H62-4876 OW S
SMB1-10A2 10 010S 020VV 4301330012 5865 FEE OVV S
KENDALL1-12A2 12 010S 020VV 4301330013 5875 FEE ONV S
CEDARRIM2 20 030S 060VV .4301330019 6315 FEE ONV S
URRUTY 2-9A2 09 010S 020W 4301330046 5855 FEE OW S
BROTHERSON 1-14B4

J¯
ÕžÕŠ040W

4301330Ò5
1̄535 FEE OW

RUST1-4B3 04 020S 030VV 4301330063 1575 FEE OVV S
WK3NSEN1-21A3 21 010S 030VV4301330082 1590 FEE O\¾ S
BFKITHERSCRM1-10B4 10 020S 040VV 4301330110 1614 FEE ONV S
FÄRNSWORTH 1-12B5 12 020S 050W 4301330124 1645 FEE OW 5
ELLSVIORTH1-16B4 16 020S 040VV .4301330192 1735 FEE ONV S
MARSHALL1-;K)A3 20 010S 030VV 4301330193 9340 FEE OVV S
CHRISTMAN BLAND 1-31B4 31 020S 040W 4301330198 4745 FEE M S
FK)PER1-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301330217 1850 FEE O\¾ S
EUROTHERSO‡l1-24B4 24 020S 040VV 4301330229 1865 FEE OVV S
BFMITHERSCRM1-33A4 33 010S 040VV 4301330272 1680 FEE ONV S
BROTHERSON 1-23B4 23 020S 040W 4301330483 8423 FEE OW S
SMITHALBERT2-8C5 08 030S 050VV 4301330543 5495 FEE OVV S
VODAJOSEPHINE2-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301330553 5650 FEE ONV S
HANSEN1-16B3 16 020S 030VV 4301330617 9124 FEE OVV S
BFMITHERSCR41-25B4 25 020S 040VV 4301330668 9126 FEE 04V S
POWELL 2-33A3 33 010S 030W 4301330704 2400 FEE OW S
BROWN2-28B5 28 020S 050W 4301330718 9131 FEE OW
EULA-UTE1-16A1 16 010S 010VV 4301330782 8443 FEE O\N S
JESSEN 1-15A4 15 010S 040VV 4301330817 9345 FEE ONV S
REK3USTON 1-22Z1 22 010N 010VV 4301330884 936 FEE 04V S
FIELDSTED 2-27A4 27 010S 040W 4301330915 9632 FEE OW S
HANSKUTT 2-23B5 _ 23 020S 050W 4301330917 9600 FEE OW S
TIMOTHY 4-18A3 18 010S 030W 4301330940 9633 FEE OW S
BFKITHERSON2-3B4 03 020S 040VV 4301331008 10165 FEE ONV S
BROTHERSON 2-22B4 22 020S 1040W 4301331086 1782 FEE OW S
MILES2-35A4 35 010S 040W 4301331087 1966 FEE OW S
ELLSWORTH 2-17B4 17 020S 040W 4301331089 1696 FEE OW
RUST 2-36A4 36 010S 040W 4301331092 1577 FEE OW S
E\h4NS2-19B3 19 020S 030VV 4301331113 1777 FEE OiN iS
FARNSWORTH 2-12BS 12 020S 050W 4301331115 1646 FEE OW S
CHRISTENSEN 3-4B4 04 020S 040W 4301331142 10481 FEE OW Š
ROBERTSON 2-29A2 29 010S 020W ¡430133115010679 , FEE OW S
CEDAR RIM2A näiÏW 4301331172 10671 E OW S

El Paso E8 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E8 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012
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LffE3-12B3 12 020S 030VV 4301331379 11490 14-20-H62-1810 OVV S
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UTE TRIBAL 2-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301331424 11615 14-20-H62-2489 OW S
UTE 1-33B6 33 020S 060W 4301330441 1230 14-20-H62-2493 OW S
UTE2-22B5 22 0206; 050VV 4301331122 10453 14-:20-H62-2509 O\N S
UTE1-1881E 18 020S 010E 4304730969 9135 14-20-H62-2864 O\¾ S
LAUREN UTE 1-23A3 23 010S 030W 4301330895 9403 14-20-H62-3981 OW S
UTE 2-28B6 28 020S 060W 4301331434 116i4 14-20-H62-4622 OW S
UTE 1-27B6X 27 020S 060W 4301330517 11166 14-20-H62-4631 OW S
UTE2-27B6 27 020S 060VV 4301331449 11660 14-20-H62-4:331 ONV S
CEDAR RIM10-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330328 6365 14-20-H62-4724 OW 5
UTE 5-30A2 30 010S 020W 4301330169 5910 14-20-H62-4863 OW S
UTE TRIBAL G-1 (1-24C6) 24 030S 060W 4301330298 4533 14-20-H62-4866 OW S
UTE TRIBAL FEDERAL 1-30C5 30 030S 050W 4301330475 665 14-20-H62-4876 OW S
SMB1-10A2 10 010S 020VV 4301330012 5865 FEE OVV S
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MARSHALL1-;K)A3 20 010S 030VV 4301330193 9340 FEE OVV S
CHRISTMAN BLAND 1-31B4 31 020S 040W 4301330198 4745 FEE M S
FK)PER1-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301330217 1850 FEE O\¾ S
EUROTHERSO‡l1-24B4 24 020S 040VV 4301330229 1865 FEE OVV S
BFMITHERSCRM1-33A4 33 010S 040VV 4301330272 1680 FEE ONV S
BROTHERSON 1-23B4 23 020S 040W 4301330483 8423 FEE OW S
SMITHALBERT2-8C5 08 030S 050VV 4301330543 5495 FEE OVV S
VODAJOSEPHINE2-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301330553 5650 FEE ONV S
HANSEN1-16B3 16 020S 030VV 4301330617 9124 FEE OVV S
BFMITHERSCR41-25B4 25 020S 040VV 4301330668 9126 FEE 04V S
POWELL 2-33A3 33 010S 030W 4301330704 2400 FEE OW S
BROWN2-28B5 28 020S 050W 4301330718 9131 FEE OW
EULA-UTE1-16A1 16 010S 010VV 4301330782 8443 FEE O\N S
JESSEN 1-15A4 15 010S 040VV 4301330817 9345 FEE ONV S
REK3USTON 1-22Z1 22 010N 010VV 4301330884 936 FEE 04V S
FIELDSTED 2-27A4 27 010S 040W 4301330915 9632 FEE OW S
HANSKUTT 2-23B5 _ 23 020S 050W 4301330917 9600 FEE OW S
TIMOTHY 4-18A3 18 010S 030W 4301330940 9633 FEE OW S
BFKITHERSON2-3B4 03 020S 040VV 4301331008 10165 FEE ONV S
BROTHERSON 2-22B4 22 020S 1040W 4301331086 1782 FEE OW S
MILES2-35A4 35 010S 040W 4301331087 1966 FEE OW S
ELLSWORTH 2-17B4 17 020S 040W 4301331089 1696 FEE OW
RUST 2-36A4 36 010S 040W 4301331092 1577 FEE OW S
E\h4NS2-19B3 19 020S 030VV 4301331113 1777 FEE OiN iS
FARNSWORTH 2-12BS 12 020S 050W 4301331115 1646 FEE OW S
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CEDAR RIM2A näiÏW 4301331172 10671 E OW S



El Paso E9 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E9 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

HARTMAN 2-31A3 31 010S 030W 4301331243 11026 FEE OW S
GOODRICH 2-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301331246 11037 FEE OW 'S
JESSEN2-:21A4 21 0106; 040VV 4301331256 11061 FEE C\N S
BROTHERSON3-23B4 23 020S 040W 4301331289 11141 FEE OW S
MYRIN FDANCH2-18B3 18 020S 030VV 4301331297 11475 FEE CAN S
BROTHERSON2-2B5 02 020S 050W 4301331302 11342 FEE OW S
DASTRUP2-30A3 30 010S 030VV 4301331320 11253 FEE 04V S
YOUNK32-30B4 30 020S 040VV 4301331366 11453 FEE ONV S
lOFK32-10B3 10 020S 030VV 4301331388 11482 FEE OVV S
WK3NSEN3-27A3 27 010S 030VV 4301331401 11686 FEE O\¾ S
HORROC‡092-5B1E 05 020S 010E 4304732409 11481 FEE CAN S
I-4RSEN1-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304730552 815 FEE OVV TA
DRYGULCH1-36A1 36 010S 0100/ 4304730569 820 FEE ONV TA

El Paso E9 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E9 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective6/1/2012
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DASTRUP2-30A3 30 010S 030VV 4301331320 11253 FEE 04V S
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WK3NSEN3-27A3 27 010S 030VV 4301331401 11686 FEE O\¾ S
HORROC‡092-5B1E 05 020S 010E 4304732409 11481 FEE CAN S
I-4RSEN1-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304730552 815 FEE OVV TA
DRYGULCH1-36A1 36 010S 0100/ 4304730569 820 FEE ONV TA



 

 

 

June 16,  2014

Thomas Iglehart
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.
1001 Louisiana
Houston, TX 77002

RE:   Designation of Workover or Recompletion, Form 15.

Dear Thomas Iglehart ,

            Enclosed is a copy of the referenced form received by the Division of Oil, Gas
and Mining for the EVANS 2-19B3 well (43013311130000).    Total expenses in the
amount  of  $ 185274.79 were submit ted for  the Production Enhancement work that
commenced on December 18,  2013 and was completed on January 4,  2014.

             Some of the submitted expenses on the referenced form were associated with
work that  does not fall  within the statutory definit ion of workover or recompletion
and/or insufficient information was supplied to enable the Division to evaluate the
submit ted  expense .
Deductions were subtracted from the total  submitted expenses for  the fol lowing
work:

Equipment  purchases

       Therefore,  your request  for designation of the expenses as qualifying
workover recomplet ion expenses is  being approved in part  for  the amount  of  $
154081 .39 .

             Please contact me at (801) 538-5281 if  you require further information
regarding this  matter .  Thank you.

       Sincerely, 

          Dustin K Doucet
           Petroleum Engineer

 

Enclosures

cc:   Utah Tax Commission w/enclosure
         Operator file

 

 

 

  1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake, City, UT 84114-5801
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DEPARTMENT OFNATURALRESOURCES

-y a), MICHAEL R. STYLER

GARY R HE RBERT Excunw Drector

Jowrnor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
SPENCERJ. COX JOHN R. E4ZA

Lieuterant (Towymr DvisionDireclor

June 16, 2014

Thomas Iglehart
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.
1001 Louisiana
Houston, TX 77002

RE: Designation of Workover or Recompletion, Form 15.

Dear Thomas Iglehart,

Enclosed is a copy of the referenced form received by the Division of Oil, Gas
and Mining for the EVANS 2-19B3 well (43013311130000). Total expenses in the
amount of $ 185274.79 were submitted for the Production Enhancement work that
commenced on December 18, 2013 and was completed on January 4, 2014.

Some of the submitted expenses on the referenced form were associated with
work that does not fall within the statutory definition of workover or recompletion
and/or insufficient information was supplied to enable the Division to evaluate the
submitted expense.
Deductions were subtracted from the total submitted expenses for the following
work:

Equipment purchases

Therefore, your request for designation of the expenses as qualifying
workover recompletion expenses is being approved in part for the amount of $
154081.39.

Please contact me at (801) 538-5281 if you require further information
regarding this matter. Thank you.

Sincerely,

Dustin K Doucet
Petroleum Engineer
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June 16, 2014

Thomas Iglehart
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.
1001 Louisiana
Houston, TX 77002

RE: Designation of Workover or Recompletion, Form 15.

Dear Thomas Iglehart,

Enclosed is a copy of the referenced form received by the Division of Oil, Gas
and Mining for the EVANS 2-19B3 well (43013311130000). Total expenses in the
amount of $ 185274.79 were submitted for the Production Enhancement work that
commenced on December 18, 2013 and was completed on January 4, 2014.

Some of the submitted expenses on the referenced form were associated with
work that does not fall within the statutory definition of workover or recompletion
and/or insufficient information was supplied to enable the Division to evaluate the
submitted expense.
Deductions were subtracted from the total submitted expenses for the following
work:

Equipment purchases

Therefore, your request for designation of the expenses as qualifying
workover recompletion expenses is being approved in part for the amount of $
154081.39.

Please contact me at (801) 538-5281 if you require further information
regarding this matter. Thank you.

Sincerely,

Dustin K Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

Enclosures

cc: Utah Tax Commission w/enclosure
Operator file

UTAH

DNR
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake, City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458

•www.ogm.utah.gov

OTI, GAS &



RECEIVED: Apr. 03, 2014

  STATE OF UTAH FORM 15 

  DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES AMENDED REPORT 

  DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING Original Filing Date: 4 /3 /2014

DESIGNATION OF WORKOVER OR RECOMPLETION
  1. Name of Operator

   EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

  2. Utah Account Number

   83850.0

  5. Well Name and Number

   EVANS 2-19B3 

  3. Address of Operator                   City         
  State      Zip

   1001 Louisiana  Houston  TX  77002 
  4. Phone Number

    713 997-5038 
  6. API Number

    4301331113

  9. Location of Well

     Footage: 1675 FSL 1727 FWL        County: DUCHESNE 

     QQ, Sec, Twnp, Rnge:    NESW 19 020S 030W      State :  UTAH 

  7. Field Name

    ALTAMONT 

  8. Field Code Number

   5 5

COMPLETE ALL SECTIONS. ATTACH ADDITIONAL SHEETS IF NEEDED.
  10. TYPE OF WORK (Check all that apply)

  Recompletion

 Repair well

 Production enhancement

 Convert to injection

  11. WORK PERIOD

   Date work commenced:  12/18/2013    89 Days From
   Date work completed:  1/4/2014          Completion

  12. THE FOLLOWING EXPENSES ARE SUBMITTED FOR DESIGNATION AS WORKOVER OR RECOMPLETION EXPENSES:
      Description Of Work Expenses Approved By State
      a. Location preparation and cleanup 0.00 0.00
      b. Move-in, rig-up, and rig-down (including trucking) 2775.00 2775.00
      c. Rig charges (including fuel) 66218.48 66218.48
      d. Drill pipe or other working string 0.00 0.00
      e. Water and chemicals for circulating fluid (including water hauling) 12969.00 12969.00
      f. Equipment purchase 31193.40 0.00
      g. Equipment rental 35241.64 35241.64
      h. Cementing 0.00 0.00
      i. Perforating 0.00 0.00
      j. Acidizing 0.00 0.00
      k. Fracture stimulation 0.00 0.00
      l. Logging services 0.00 0.00
      m. Supervision and overhead 19202.27 19202.27
      n. Other (itemize)                   Swabbing 17675.00 17675.00
                               0 0.00 0.00
                               0 0.00 0.00
                                0.00 0.00
      o. Total submitted expenses 185274.79  
      p. Total approved expenses (State use only)   154081.39

 

  13. LIST CONTRACTORS PROVIDING SERVICES VALUED AT MORE THAN $3,000.
Contractor Location (City, State) Services Provided

HOT OIL EXPRESS INC Altamont Utah Water
NABORS COMPLETION and
PRODUCTION SERVICES Roosevelt Utah Rig Charges

WEATHERFORD ARTIFICIAL LIFT SYSTEM
LLC Roosevelt Utah Equipment

WILLIES HOT OIL SERVICE Roosevelt Utah Rig Charges

  14. LIST WORKING INTEREST OWNERS WHO TAKE PRODUCT IN KIND AND ARE AUTHORIZED TO SHARE IN THE TAX
CREDIT.

Name Address Utah Account No. Percent of
Interest

  I hereby certify that this report is true and complete to the best of my knowledge.
  NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  Thomas Iglehart   TITLE  Senior Accountant       PHONE   713 997-2791
  SIGNATURE  Thomas Iglehart   DATE  April 3, 2014       E-MAIL  thomas.iglehart@epenergy.com

June 16,  2014

Tax Credit Number: 49640 API Well Number: 43013311130000Tax Credit Number: 49640 API Well Number: 43013311130000

STATE OF UTAH FORM 15

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES AMENDEDREPORT

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING Original Filing Date: 4/3/2014

DESIGNATION OF WORKOVER OR RECOMPLETION
1. Name of Operator 2. Utah Account Number 5. Well Name and Number
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY,L.P. 83850.0 EVANS 2-19B3

3. Address of Operator City
State Zip 4. Phone Number 6. API Number

1001 Louisiana Houston TX 77002 713 997-5038 4301331113
9. Location of Well 7. Field Name

ALTAMONT
Footage: 1675 FSL 1727 FWL County: DUCHESNE 8. Field Code Number

QQ, Sec, Twnp, Rnge: NESW 19 020S 030W State : UTAH 55

COMPLETE ALL SECTIONS. ATTACH ADDITIONAL SHEETS IF NEEDED.
10. TYPE OF WORK (Check all that apply) 11. WORK PERIOD

Production enhancement Recompletion Date work commenced: 12/18/2013 89 Days From
convert to injection Repair well Date work completed: 1/4/2014 Completion

12. THE FOLLOWING EXPENSES ARE SUBMITTED FOR DESIGNATION AS WORKOVER OR RECOMPLETION EXPENSES:
Description Of Work Expenses Approved By State
a. Location preparation and cleanup 0.00 0.00
b. Move-in, rig-up, and rig-down (including trucking) 2775.00 2775.00
c. Rig charges (including fuel) 66218.48 66218.48
d. Drill pipe or other working string 0.00 0.00
e. Water and chemicals for circulating fluid (including water hauling) 12969.00 12969.00
f. Equipment purchase ApprOved by the 31193.40 0.00
g. Equipment rental 35241.64 35241.64
h. Cementing Utah Division of o.oo o.oo
i. Perforating Oil, Gas and Mining °·°0 °·°0
j. Acidizing 0.00 0.00
k. Fracture stimulation 0.00 0.00
I. Logging services Date: June 16, 2014 o.oo o.oo
m. Supervision and overhead i \ -y 19202.27 19202.27
n. Other (itemize) Swabbing i 17675.00 17675.00

o By: )J/ o.oo o.oo
O ' 0.001 0.00

0.00 0.00
o. Total submitted expenses 185274.79
p. Total approved expenses (State use only) 154081.39

13. LIST CONTRACTORS PROVIDING SERVICES VALUED AT MORE THAN $3,000.
Contractor Location (City, State) Services Provided

HOT OIL EXPRESS INC Altamont Utah Water
NABORS COMPLETION and Roosevelt Utah Rig ChargesPRODUCTION SERVICES
WEATHERFORD ARTIFICIAL LIFT SYSTEM .

LLC Roosevelt Utah Equipment

WILLIES HOT OIL SERVICE Roosevelt Utah Rig Charges
14. LIST WORKING INTEREST OWNERS WHO TAKE PRODUCT IN KIND AND ARE AUTHORIZED TO SHARE IN THE TAX

CREDIT.
Name Address Utah Account No. Percent of

Interest

I hereby certify that this report is true and complete to the best of my knowledge.
NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Thomas Iglehart TITLE Senior Accountant PHONE 713 997-2791
SIGNATURE Thomas Iglehart DATE April 3, 2014 E-MAIL thomas.iglehart@epenergy.com

RECEIVED: Apr. 03,

Tax Credit Number: 49640 API Well Number: 43013311130000

STATE OF UTAH FORM 15

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES AMENDEDREPORT

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING Original Filing Date: 4/3/2014

DESIGNATION OF WORKOVER OR RECOMPLETION
1. Name of Operator 2. Utah Account Number 5. Well Name and Number

EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY,L.P. 83850.0 EVANS 2-19B3

3. Address of Operator City
State Zip 4. Phone Number 6. API Number

1001 Louisiana Houston TX 77002 713 997-5038 4301331113
9. Location of Well 7. Field Name

ALTAMONT

Footage: 1675 FSL 1727 FWL County: DUCHESNE 8. Field Code Number
QQ, Sec, Twnp, Rnge: NESW 19 020S 030W State : UTAH 55

COMPLETE ALL SECTIONS. ATTACH ADDITIONAL SHEETS IF NEEDED.
10. TYPE OF WORK (Check all that apply) 11. WORK PERIOD

Production enhancement Recompletion Date work commenced: 12/18/2013 89 Days From
convert to injection Repair well Date work completed: 1/4/2014 Completion

12. THE FOLLOWING EXPENSES ARE SUBMITTED FOR DESIGNATION AS WORKOVER OR RECOMPLETION EXPENSES:
Description Of Work Expenses Approved By State
a. Location preparation and cleanup 0.00 0.00
b. Move-in, rig-up, and rig-down (including trucking) 2775.00 2775.00
c. Rig charges (including fuel) 66218.48 66218.48
d. Drill pipe or other working string 0.00 0.00
e. Water and chemicals for circulating fluid (including water hauling) 12969.00 12969.00
f. Equipment purchase ApprOved by the 31193.40 0.00
g. Equipment rental 35241.64 35241.64
h. Cementing Utah Division of o.oo o.oo
i. Perforating Oil, Gas and Mining °·°0 °·°0
j. Acidizing 0.00 0.00
k. Fracture stimulation 0.00 0.00
I. Logging services Date: June 16, 2014 o.oo o.oo
m. Supervision and overhead i \ -y 19202.27 19202.27
n. Other (itemize) Swabbing i 17675.00 17675.00

o By: )J/ o.oo o.oo
O ' 0.001 0.00

0.00 0.00
o. Total submitted expenses 185274.79
p. Total approved expenses (State use only) 154081.39

13. LIST CONTRACTORS PROVIDING SERVICES VALUED AT MORE THAN $3,000.
Contractor Location (City, State) Services Provided

HOT OIL EXPRESS INC Altamont Utah Water
NABORS COMPLETION and Roosevelt Utah Rig ChargesPRODUCTION SERVICES
WEATHERFORD ARTIFICIAL LIFT SYSTEM .

LLC Roosevelt Utah Equipment

WILLIES HOT OIL SERVICE Roosevelt Utah Rig Charges

14. LIST WORKING INTEREST OWNERS WHO TAKE PRODUCT IN KIND AND ARE AUTHORIZED TO SHARE IN THE TAX
CREDIT.

Name Address Utah Account No. Percent of
Interest

I hereby certify that this report is true and complete to the best of my knowledge.
NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Thomas Iglehart TITLE Senior Accountant PHONE 713 997-2791
SIGNATURE Thomas Iglehart DATE April 3, 2014 E-MAIL thomas.iglehart@epenergy.com

RECEIVED: Apr. 03,



RECEIVED: Apr. 03, 2014

Tax Credit Number: 49640 API Well Number: 43013311130000Tax Credit Number: 49640 API Well Number: 43013311130000

STATEOFUTAH FORM15

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES AMENDED REPORT

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING Original Filing Date:

DESIGNATION OF WORKOVER OR RECOMPLETION

1. Name of Operator EP Energy E&P Company, LP 2. Utah Account No.; N3850 5. Well Name & Number.:
EVANS 2-19B3

3. Address of Operator 1001 Louisiana Houston, TX 77002 4. Phone No. (713) 997-2791 6. API No. 43-013-31113

9. Location of Well: 7. Field Name ALTAMONT

Footage: 1675 FSL 1727 FWL County DUCHESNE

QQ,Section, Township, Range NESW 0019 205 30W State UTAH 8. Field Code No. 055

COMPLETE ALL SECTIONS. ATTACH ADDITIONAL SHEETS IF NEEDED.

10. TYPE OF WORK (Check all that appfy) 11. WORK PERIOD

Production Enhancement Recompletion Date work commenced 12/18/2013

Convert to injection Repair Well Date work completed 01/04/2014

12. THE FOLLOWING EXPENSES FOR OPERATIONS ARE SUBMITTED FOR DESIGNATION AS WORKOVER OR RECOMPLETION EXPENSES

Expenses Approved by State

a. Location preparation and cleanup

b. Move-in, rig-up and rig-down (including trucking) 2775.00

c, Rig Charges (including fuel) 66218.48

d. Drill pipe or other working string

e. Water and chemicals for circulating fluid (including water haullng) 12969.00

f. Equipment purchase 31193.40

g. Equipment rental 35241.64

h. Cementing

i. Perforating

j. Acidizing

k. Fracture stimulation

I. Logging services

m. Supervision and overhead 19202.27

n. Other(Itemize)

Swabbing 17675.00

o. Total submitted expenses 185274.79

p. Total approved expenses (State use only)

13. LIST CONTRACTORS PROVIDING SERVICES VALUEDAT MORE THAN $3,000

Contractor Location {City, State) Services Provided

HOT OIL EXPRESS INC ALTAMONT,UTAH Water
NABORS COMPLETION & PRODUCTION SERVICES ROOSEVELT, UTAH Rig Charges

WEATHERFORD ARTIFICIAL LIFT SYSTEM LLC ROOSEVELT, UTAH Equipment

WILLIES HOT OIL SERVICE ROOSEVELT, UTAH Rig Charges

14. LIST WORKING INTEREST OWNERS WHO TAKE PRODUCT IN KIND AND ARE AUTHORIZED TO SHARE IN THE TAX CREDIT

Na ne Address ' Utah AccountNo. Percentoflnterest

I hereby certify that this report is tgµe and compi to the be t of my knowledge.

Name (Please Print) Thoma glehart Title: Accountant

Signature: Date:

Tax Credit Number: 49640 API Well Number: 43013311130000

STATEOFUTAH FORM15

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES AMENDED REPORT

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING Original Filing Date:

DESIGNATION OF WORKOVER OR RECOMPLETION

1. Name of Operator EP Energy E&P Company, LP 2. Utah Account No.; N3850 5. Well Name & Number.:
EVANS 2-19B3

3. Address of Operator 1001 Louisiana Houston, TX 77002 4. Phone No. (713) 997-2791 6. API No. 43-013-31113

9. Location of Well: 7. Field Name ALTAMONT

Footage: 1675 FSL 1727 FWL County DUCHESNE

QQ,Section, Township, Range NESW 0019 205 30W State UTAH 8. Field Code No. 055

COMPLETE ALL SECTIONS. ATTACH ADDITIONAL SHEETS IF NEEDED.

10. TYPE OF WORK (Check all that appfy) 11. WORK PERIOD

Production Enhancement Recompletion Date work commenced 12/18/2013

Convert to injection Repair Well Date work completed 01/04/2014

12. THE FOLLOWING EXPENSES FOR OPERATIONS ARE SUBMITTED FOR DESIGNATION AS WORKOVER OR RECOMPLETION EXPENSES

Expenses Approved by State

a. Location preparation and cleanup

b. Move-in, rig-up and rig-down (including trucking) 2775.00

c, Rig Charges (including fuel) 66218.48

d. Drill pipe or other working string

e. Water and chemicals for circulating fluid (including water haullng) 12969.00

f. Equipment purchase 31193.40

g. Equipment rental 35241.64

h. Cementing

i. Perforating

j. Acidizing

k. Fracture stimulation

I. Logging services

m. Supervision and overhead 19202.27

n. Other(Itemize)

Swabbing 17675.00

o. Total submitted expenses 185274.79

p. Total approved expenses (State use only)

13. LIST CONTRACTORS PROVIDING SERVICES VALUEDAT MORE THAN $3,000

Contractor Location {City, State) Services Provided

HOT OIL EXPRESS INC ALTAMONT,UTAH Water

NABORS COMPLETION & PRODUCTION SERVICES ROOSEVELT, UTAH Rig Charges

WEATHERFORD ARTIFICIAL LIFT SYSTEM LLC ROOSEVELT, UTAH Equipment

WILLIES HOT OIL SERVICE ROOSEVELT, UTAH Rig Charges

14. LIST WORKING INTEREST OWNERS WHO TAKE PRODUCT IN KIND AND ARE AUTHORIZED TO SHARE IN THE TAX CREDIT

Na ne Address ' Utah AccountNo. Percentoflnterest

I hereby certify that this report is tgµe and compi to the be t of my knowledge.

Name (Please Print) Thoma glehart Title: Accountant

Signature: Date:



RECEIVED: Apr. 03, 2014

Tax Credit Number: 49640 API Well Number: 43013311130000Tax Credit Number: 49640 API Well Number: 43013311130000

Sundry Number: 49623 API Well Number: 43013311130000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS, AND MlNING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

Oil Well EVANS 2-19B3

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGYE&PCOMPANY,L.P. 43013311130000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1675 FSL 1727 FWL
QTRIOTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 19 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATEBOXESTO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE,REPORT. OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAlR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIDUS PLANS CHANGE TUBLNG CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximale dele work w!II start:

O CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CO‡dVERTWELL TYPE

/ SUESEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

1/4/2014 O OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

O sean nero., O PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATIONOF WELL SifË RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

O REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATFON SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

O TUBING86PAIN VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

O DRILLINGREPORT
R.port Da a: WATER $HUTOFF BI TA STATUS EXTENSlON APD EXTENSION

O WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATlON OTHER OTHER: Drilled ou I plugs

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATlONS. Clearly show all pertinent details lncluding dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Drilled out plugs at 10050' & 10550'.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gornez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 4/2/2014

RECEIVED: Apr. 02,

Tax Credit Number: 49640 API Well Number: 43013311130000

Sundry Number: 49623 API Well Number: 43013311130000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS, AND MlNING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well EVANS 2-19B3

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGYE&PCOMPANY,L.P. 43013311130000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1675 FSL 1727 FWL
QTRIOTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 19 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATEBOXESTO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE,REPORT. OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAlR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIDUS PLANS CHANGE TUBLNG CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximale dele work w!II start:

O CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CO‡dVERTWELL TYPE

/ SUESEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

1/4/2014 O OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

O sean nero., O PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATIONOF WELL SifË RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

O REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATFON SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

O TUBING86PAIN VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

O DRILLINGREPORT
R.port Da a: WATER $HUTOFF BI TA STATUS EXTENSlON APD EXTENSION

O WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATlON OTHER OTHER: Drilled ou I plugs

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATlONS. Clearly show all pertinent details lncluding dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Drilled out plugs at 10050' & 10550'.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gornez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 4/2/2014

RECEIVED: Apr. 02,



RECEIVED: Apr. 03, 2014

Tax Credit Number: 49640 API Well Number: 43013311130000Tax Credit Number: 49640 API Well Number: 43013311130000

Sundry Number: 49623 API Well Number: 43013311130000

CENTilAL DIVISION

2.1 Operation Summary {Continued)

MMMMMtWM¾amm
11 3rl 1300 1.50 WBP 18 P X VER FROM TBG EQUIP, TO ROD EQUIP

RU HOT DILER
.

FLUSH TOGWI 60 BBLS2% KCL
MOD 7500 2.00 WBP 03 P PU&PRIMEWEATHEAFORD

2 1/2" A 1 U2" X 3 RHBC PUMP. i LEARED]WAIT40 MtN. FOR
NFW PUMP. PIU & PRIME GOOD
WFLL TO SALES. SOFN. HIGH WIND

imm;¿OT2 ? DO 9.00 2.00 WBP 28 P TRAVE.LTO LOCATION. HSM. P/U WEIGHTBARS
HOT OILER FLUSH TBG Wi 60 BBLS KCL

9 00 la 00 5.00 WEP 03 P P/U & RiH Wt 2 1r2" X 1 1/2" X 38' INSERT PUMP WI 21' GAS
ANCHOR STINGER.
8.. 1 lir K SiNKER BARS
197 3/4 EL RODS MrXEO
134 -7/8" EL ROOS MixED
64 - r EL RODS SLICK
22. l' PONY RODS
40' POUSH ROD
FILL TBG WI 29 BBLS PSI T£5T TO 500# Wi HOT DILER.
STROKE TO 10DD# (GOOD TEST}HANG OFF

AIODOWN
117 K SINKER BAR3

/4 EL RODS WI 3DMHOLE GUIDES"EL WIGUlDES
32 1" 6 L SLICA

la 00 is 30 1 50 WSP 18 P R.ACKOUT EQUIPMENT, RDMO
iWo 17 00 1 50 POST M P SLIDEROTAFLEX.PWOP, NOT TAGGING

L' 00 1:t .40 1 50 MIRU 97 P MOVE. RIG TO MANSON4-883

1:"10/2013 E 00 30 1 50 PRDHED 19 P REVI TRAVEL WRtTË & REVIEW JSA ( EOPIC ; DRIVING
DOLLLCIË$

? 30 10 40 3 17 PRDHEQ 18 P GLAMPorF RODS. 3LIDE ROTAFLE.XBACK MIRU. PUMP 0
BOLSflOT 2% DOWN CSG, BLOW DOWN rBC. UNSEAT 90419

i i 40 0 di 1 08 PRDNEQ 18 P RU HOTOILER. FLUSH RODS WI 60 BBLS HOT 2%
11 as A 00 3 25 PRDHEO 39 P POOH Wi be-1". 114-7/8". 197-314" UD 8-1 Tir K-BARS& 2

1Œ X 1 1/2 X 3Œ PUMP W/21· UlP TUBE FLUSH RODSAs
NEEDED POOH

15 00 17 30 2.50 PRDHEO IS P X.OVER FO TBG EDUIP NIDWELLHEAD.PUT & SUB UNDER
TRG HANGER. IWUBOPS. RíU FLOOR &TONGS. RELEASE 5"
ANCHOR g 10.010, POOH WI $ JTS 2 718", SECURE WELL
SOEN

12/2W¿Ui3 600 7 30 3 50 PRDHEQ TA P CREW TRAVEL WRITE A REVIEWJSA( TOPIC ) ICY StJCK
SURFACES

i .40 1 00 5 50 PROMEO N P BLOW OOWN CSO. CONTlNUE POOH Wt 108 JTS 2 78' L/D
PSN 4 W2 PBGA. 2 JTS 2 719^. SOLID PLUG. X-OVER FO 2 3/8
2 JTS 2 3if & 5 TAC

i 4 50 PRDHED E P PfU 1 TM MILL SI f SUli, 4 - 3 1/8 GOLLARS. X OVI-R SUR. 8' 2
TUUNJS4 54 JfS2WS TOC.XOVER TO 27/8'EQUlD.

PlH "ALLEYWi?G JTS27;S" EOT@4302 SEQURE WELL
iWN

O PRDHl.c REW TRAUG WRYG i REVIEW JSA . [OPic I POWER SWlVEl.
00 PRDHL N1|NUL inHW 'WJTS27T. TAG Ci MLNT 10.045.UDA

TS TIL BACK
1- e JW PRDHED U POWER SMVEl 6. PUMP LlNES. PUM.PFD MS BBL3 Tia

O WN GSG TO GET CfRCU(ATION

Arn10) ¿011.11 a. om 10

Tax Credit Number: 49640 API Well Number: 43013311130000

Sundry Number: 49623 API Well Number: 43013311130000

CENTilAL DIVISION

2.1 Operation Summary {Continued)

MMMMMtWM¾amm
11 3rl 1300 1.50 WBP 18 P X VER FROM TBG EQUIP, TO ROD EQUIP

RU HOT DILER
.

FLUSH TOGWI 60 BBLS2% KCL
MOD 7500 2.00 WBP 03 P PU&PRIMEWEATHEAFORD

2 1/2" A 1 U2" X 3 RHBC PUMP. i LEARED]WAIT40 MtN. FOR
NFW PUMP. PIU & PRIME GOOD
WFLL TO SALES. SOFN. HIGH WIND

imm;¿OT2 ? DO 9.00 2.00 WBP 28 P TRAVE.LTO LOCATION. HSM. P/U WEIGHTBARS
HOT OILER FLUSH TBG Wi 60 BBLS KCL

9 00 la 00 5.00 WEP 03 P P/U & RiH Wt 2 1r2" X 1 1/2" X 38' INSERT PUMP WI 21' GAS
ANCHOR STINGER.
8.. 1 lir K SiNKER BARS
197 3/4 EL RODS MrXEO
134 -7/8" EL ROOS MixED
64 - r EL RODS SLICK
22. l' PONY RODS
40' POUSH ROD
FILL TBG WI 29 BBLS PSI T£5T TO 500# Wi HOT DILER.
STROKE TO 10DD# (GOOD TEST}HANG OFF

AIODOWN
117 K SINKER BAR3

/4 EL RODS WI 3DMHOLE GUIDES"EL WIGUlDES
32 1" 6 L SLICA

la 00 is 30 1 50 WSP 18 P R.ACKOUT EQUIPMENT, RDMO
iWo 17 00 1 50 POST M P SLIDEROTAFLEX.PWOP, NOT TAGGING

L' 00 1:t .40 1 50 MIRU 97 P MOVE. RIG TO MANSON4-883

1:"10/2013 E 00 30 1 50 PRDHED 19 P REVI TRAVEL WRtTË & REVIEW JSA ( EOPIC ; DRIVING
DOLLLCIË$

? 30 10 40 3 17 PRDHEQ 18 P GLAMPorF RODS. 3LIDE ROTAFLE.XBACK MIRU. PUMP 0
BOLSflOT 2% DOWN CSG, BLOW DOWN rBC. UNSEAT 90419

i i 40 0 di 1 08 PRDNEQ 18 P RU HOTOILER. FLUSH RODS WI 60 BBLS HOT 2%
11 as A 00 3 25 PRDHEO 39 P POOH Wi be-1". 114-7/8". 197-314" UD 8-1 Tir K-BARS& 2

1Œ X 1 1/2 X 3Œ PUMP W/21· UlP TUBE FLUSH RODSAs
NEEDED POOH

15 00 17 30 2.50 PRDHEO IS P X.OVER FO TBG EDUIP NIDWELLHEAD.PUT & SUB UNDER
TRG HANGER. IWUBOPS. RíU FLOOR &TONGS. RELEASE 5"
ANCHOR g 10.010, POOH WI $ JTS 2 718", SECURE WELL
SOEN

12/2W¿Ui3 600 7 30 3 50 PRDHEQ TA P CREW TRAVEL WRITE A REVIEWJSA( TOPIC ) ICY StJCK
SURFACES

i .40 1 00 5 50 PROMEO N P BLOW OOWN CSO. CONTlNUE POOH Wt 108 JTS 2 78' L/D
PSN 4 W2 PBGA. 2 JTS 2 719^. SOLID PLUG. X-OVER FO 2 3/8
2 JTS 2 3if & 5 TAC

i 4 50 PRDHED E P PfU 1 TM MILL SI f SUli, 4 - 3 1/8 GOLLARS. X OVI-R SUR. 8' 2
TUUNJS4 54 JfS2WS TOC.XOVER TO 27/8'EQUlD.

PlH "ALLEYWi?G JTS27;S" EOT@4302 SEQURE WELL
iWN

O PRDHl.c REW TRAUG WRYG i REVIEW JSA . [OPic I POWER SWlVEl.
00 PRDHL N1|NUL inHW 'WJTS27T. TAG Ci MLNT 10.045.UDA

TS TIL BACK
1- e JW PRDHED U POWER SMVEl 6. PUMP LlNES. PUM.PFD MS BBL3 Tia

O WN GSG TO GET CfRCU(ATION

Arn10) ¿011.11 a. om 10



RECEIVED: Apr. 03, 2014

Tax Credit Number: 49640 API Well Number: 43013311130000Tax Credit Number: 49640 API Well Number: 43013311130000

Sundry Number: 49623 API Well Number: 43013311130000

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued}

14 00 17 00 3 00 PRDHEO 39 P DRiLLUP 5°CEMENT ¶AßT DRILLINGON CISP. CIRCULATE
WELLCLEAN, RID POWER SWIVEL POOH WI 4 JTS 2 7/B"
SECURE WELL. DRAIN PUMP LINES. SDFLW

12/22/2013 6 00 8.00 24 00 PRDHEQ IS P NOACTIVITY SDFW

12/23:20i3 6 00 6 00 24 00 PRDHEO 18 P NO AGTIVITY. SDFW
12/24/2013 6 00 6 00 24 00 PRDHEO 18 P NOACTIVITY.SHUT DOWN FOR HOUDAY

12/26/2013 6.00 6 00 24 00 PRDHEO 18 P NO ACTIVITY.SHUT DOWN FOR HOUDAY

12i26 2013 20 58 6 00 9.03 PRDHEO 18 P NO ACTIVITY. SHUT DOWN FOR HOUDAY

12/2712D13 6 00 7 30 1 50 PRDHEO 28 P CREW TRAVEL WRITE & REVIEW JSA ( TOPlc )POWER SWIVEL

7 30 11 15 3 75 PROHËQ 39 P RIH WJ 4 JTS 2 7/8". RiU POWER SWlVEL & PUMP LINES.
PUMPED 330 BBLS DOWN CSG UP TBG TOGET CIRCULATION

11 15 17 00 5 76 PRDHEO 39 P STARTMILUNGON CIBP @ ig DRILLUP PLUG. C1RC HOLE
CLEAN. MAKE2 CONNECTIONS, RID SWIVEL, POOH WI 10 JTS.
EOT@ 9920', SECURE WELL,DRAINPUMP UNES. SDFN

12:28/2013 6 00 7 3Ò 1 50 PROHEO 28 P CREW TRAVELWRITE & REVIEWJSA (TOPIC )ELECTRIC1TY
POLICLES

7 30 11 30 4.00 PRDHEO 39 P R1H W120 JTS 2 7/8", PUSH PLUG FROM 10.216 TO 10.533 . R/U
POWER SWlVEL& PUMP l.lNES, BREAK CIRCULATIONWl418
BBLS

11 30 18 00 6 50 PRDMEO 39 P MILL ON REMAINSOF IST PLUG. PUMPING4 BBLS MIN
GETTING BACK1BBL.HARD MILLING,TRYlNGTO PLUG OFF
THE MILL MILLEDUP PLUG, START ON 2ND PLUG. CIRCULATE
WELL CLEAN, RID SWIVEL. POOH W/ 22 JTS 2 7/8" SECURE
WELL, DRAIN PUMP LINES. SDFN

12:29/2013 6 00 730 1 50 PRDHEO 2ß P CREW TRAVELWRITE & REV)EW JSA (TOPFC)LIFTING

7 30 10 15 2 75 PROHEO 39 P RíH WI 24 JTS 2 7ta
. Riu POWER SWlVEL PUMPED 293 BBLS

TO GET ClRCULATtON
1G 15 14 30 4 25 PROHEO 39 P MILL ON REMAINSOF PLUG. PLUGGED OFF MILL DRYMILL

WHILEPUMPING DOWN CSG. NOT MAKINGNO HOLE. POOH
14 30 18 00 3 50 PROHEQ 39 P RtD SWtvEL. POOH W/ 151 JTS2 7/8". SECURE WELL, DRAIN

PUMP LINES. EOT @6,919. SDFW
12/30/2013 6 00 6 00 2d 00 PRDHEQ 18 P NOACTIVITY, SDFW

12/31/2013 600 7 30 1 50 PROHEQ 28 P CREWTRAVEL WRITE & REVIEW JSA( TOPIC) CONFINED
SPACES

730 12 30 $ 00 PRDHEQ 39 P CONTINUEPOOH WET Wi 165 JTS 2 728". X-OVER TO 2 3/8". 54
JTS 2 3/8" TBG X-OVER SUB. 4-3 Ils" COLLARS. StT SUB & 4

118" MILL. L;D PLUGGED BOTTOMCOLLAR & MILL WAS WORN
OUT

12 30 17 30 S 00 PRDHEQ 39 P P/U 4 1/8" MILL.JUNK BASKET, X-OVER SUB, 3 31ie"
CO1..\..ARS.RIH Wi 3 sia" COL1ARS. K- OVER SUB 54 JTS 2

8 .

X-OVER TO 2 'te" & 244 JTS 2 7/8" SECURE WELL SDFD
EOT @ 9.926'

l'1/201a 6.00 7 30 1 50 PRDHEO 28 P CREW TRAVEL WRITE & REVIEWJSA (TOP1C)PUMP &MUD
SYSTEMS

T 30 9 00 1 50 PRDHEO 39 P RiH Wi 22 JTS 2 7/8". RIU POWER SWIVEL BREAK
CIRCULATIONWI 205 BBLS 2% KCL

9 00 10 30 7 50 PRDHEO 72 P CLEAN OUT 22' FILL, DRILL UP CIPB @10.550", WELL WENT ON
VACUUM RtD SWIVEL

16 30 19 00 2 50 PROHEO 39 P RLH Wi 36 JTS 2 7/8" PUSHJNG PLUG TO PSTO @ 11.585 POOH
WISOJTS27/6"ABOVE LWERTOPEOT@9.926' SECURE
WELL SDFN

1/2/20td 6 00 600 zu 00 PRDHEQ 18 P SHUT DOWN FOR NEWVEAR
i 1 2914 6 00 7 30 1 50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVELWRITE & REVIEW JSA ( TOPIC i HANDLING&

HAULINGRIPF
w 11 30 -1 00 PRDHED 39 P POOH W: 256 JTS 2 Tis X-OVER TO 2 3/8 EOUIP

Anni 92 2014 at 12 TT pro 11

Tax Credit Number: 49640 API Well Number: 43013311130000

Sundry Number: 49623 API Well Number: 43013311130000

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued}

14 00 17 00 3 00 PRDHEO 39 P DRiLLUP 5°CEMENT ¶AßT DRILLINGON CISP. CIRCULATE
WELLCLEAN, RID POWER SWIVEL POOH WI 4 JTS 2 7/B"
SECURE WELL. DRAIN PUMP LINES. SDFLW

12/22/2013 6 00 8.00 24 00 PRDHEQ IS P NOACTIVITY SDFW

12/23:20i3 6 00 6 00 24 00 PRDHEO 18 P NO AGTIVITY. SDFW
12/24/2013 6 00 6 00 24 00 PRDHEO 18 P NOACTIVITY.SHUT DOWN FOR HOUDAY

12/26/2013 6.00 6 00 24 00 PRDHEO 18 P NO ACTIVITY.SHUT DOWN FOR HOUDAY

12i26 2013 20 58 6 00 9.03 PRDHEO 18 P NO ACTIVITY. SHUT DOWN FOR HOUDAY

12/2712D13 6 00 7 30 1 50 PRDHEO 28 P CREW TRAVEL WRITE & REVIEW JSA ( TOPlc )POWER SWIVEL

7 30 11 15 3 75 PROHËQ 39 P RIH WJ 4 JTS 2 7/8". RiU POWER SWlVEL & PUMP LINES.
PUMPED 330 BBLS DOWN CSG UP TBG TOGET CIRCULATION

11 15 17 00 5 76 PRDHEO 39 P STARTMILUNGON CIBP @ ig DRILLUP PLUG. C1RC HOLE
CLEAN. MAKE2 CONNECTIONS, RID SWIVEL, POOH WI 10 JTS.
EOT@ 9920', SECURE WELL,DRAINPUMP UNES. SDFN

12:28/2013 6 00 7 3Ò 1 50 PROHEO 28 P CREW TRAVELWRITE & REVIEWJSA (TOPIC )ELECTRIC1TY
POLICLES

7 30 11 30 4.00 PRDHEO 39 P R1H W120 JTS 2 7/8", PUSH PLUG FROM 10.216 TO 10.533 . R/U
POWER SWlVEL& PUMP l.lNES, BREAK CIRCULATIONWl418
BBLS

11 30 18 00 6 50 PRDMEO 39 P MILL ON REMAINSOF IST PLUG. PUMPING4 BBLS MIN
GETTING BACK1BBL.HARD MILLING,TRYlNGTO PLUG OFF
THE MILL MILLEDUP PLUG, START ON 2ND PLUG. CIRCULATE
WELL CLEAN, RID SWIVEL. POOH W/ 22 JTS 2 7/8" SECURE
WELL, DRAIN PUMP LINES. SDFN

12:29/2013 6 00 730 1 50 PRDHEO 2ß P CREW TRAVELWRITE & REV)EW JSA (TOPFC)LIFTING

7 30 10 15 2 75 PROHEO 39 P RíH WI 24 JTS 2 7ta
. Riu POWER SWlVEL PUMPED 293 BBLS

TO GET ClRCULATtON
1G 15 14 30 4 25 PROHEO 39 P MILL ON REMAINSOF PLUG. PLUGGED OFF MILL DRYMILL

WHILEPUMPING DOWN CSG. NOT MAKINGNO HOLE. POOH
14 30 18 00 3 50 PROHEQ 39 P RtD SWtvEL. POOH W/ 151 JTS2 7/8". SECURE WELL, DRAIN

PUMP LINES. EOT @6,919. SDFW
12/30/2013 6 00 6 00 2d 00 PRDHEQ 18 P NOACTIVITY, SDFW

12/31/2013 600 7 30 1 50 PROHEQ 28 P CREWTRAVEL WRITE & REVIEW JSA( TOPIC) CONFINED
SPACES

730 12 30 $ 00 PRDHEQ 39 P CONTINUEPOOH WET Wi 165 JTS 2 728". X-OVER TO 2 3/8". 54
JTS 2 3/8" TBG X-OVER SUB. 4-3 Ils" COLLARS. StT SUB & 4

118" MILL. L;D PLUGGED BOTTOMCOLLAR & MILL WAS WORN
OUT

12 30 17 30 S 00 PRDHEQ 39 P P/U 4 1/8" MILL.JUNK BASKET, X-OVER SUB, 3 31ie"
CO1..\..ARS.RIH Wi 3 sia" COL1ARS. K- OVER SUB 54 JTS 2

8 .

X-OVER TO 2 'te" & 244 JTS 2 7/8" SECURE WELL SDFD
EOT @ 9.926'

l'1/201a 6.00 7 30 1 50 PRDHEO 28 P CREW TRAVEL WRITE & REVIEWJSA (TOP1C)PUMP &MUD
SYSTEMS

T 30 9 00 1 50 PRDHEO 39 P RiH Wi 22 JTS 2 7/8". RIU POWER SWIVEL BREAK
CIRCULATIONWI 205 BBLS 2% KCL

9 00 10 30 7 50 PRDHEO 72 P CLEAN OUT 22' FILL, DRILL UP CIPB @10.550", WELL WENT ON
VACUUM RtD SWIVEL

16 30 19 00 2 50 PROHEO 39 P RLH Wi 36 JTS 2 7/8" PUSHJNG PLUG TO PSTO @ 11.585 POOH
WISOJTS27/6"ABOVE LWERTOPEOT@9.926' SECURE
WELL SDFN

1/2/20td 6 00 600 zu 00 PRDHEQ 18 P SHUT DOWN FOR NEWVEAR
i 1 2914 6 00 7 30 1 50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVELWRITE & REVIEW JSA ( TOPIC i HANDLING&

HAULINGRIPF
w 11 30 -1 00 PRDHED 39 P POOH W: 256 JTS 2 Tis X-OVER TO 2 3/8 EOUIP

Anni 92 2014 at 12 TT pro 11



RECEIVED: Apr. 03, 2014

Tax Credit Number: 49640 API Well Number: 43013311130000Tax Credit Number: 49640 API Well Number: 43013311130000

Sundry Number: 49623 API Well Number: 43013311130000

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

i 1T 30 14 15 2 75 PROHEO 24 P LAY DOWN 54 JTS 2 3/8" TSG, 3 -3 1/8" DRILLCOLLARS & 4
118" MPLL

14 15 15 25 1 17 PRDHEO 24 P PUT 15 DIP TUBE INPBGA, PIU BHA,5" SUM HOLETAC,2 JTS 2
3/8". 2 3/8" SOLlD PLUG, X-O TO 2 7/8". 2 JTS 27/8" 4 1/2"
PSGA. 2' 2 7/8" TBG SUB. 2 7/8" PSN, 4' 2 718"TBG SUB.

15 25 17 30 2.08 PROHEO 39 P RIH WI 194 JTS 2 7/8". SECURE WELL, SDFD, EOT @$235·

1/412014 6 00 7 30 1 50 PRDHEO 29 P CREW TRAVEL WRlTE & REVIEW JSA (TOPIC )PROTECTlON
EOutPMENT

7 30 8 50 1 33 PRDHEO 39 P FINISH RIH WI $2 JTS 2 TIS". SET 6" TAC@ 10,010'. R/D TONOS
& FLOOR

S 50 10:15 1 42 PROHEQ 16 P N/D 80P'S. LANDTBG IN23.000 LBS TENSION NIU WELLHEAD
& FLOW LINES

10 in 11 00 0 75 PRDHEQ 10 P FLUSH TBG W150 BBLS HOT 2%
TT00 17 00 6 00 PRDHED 39 P X-O TO ROD EQUIPMENT P/U PRIME2 1/2" X I 314"X 36" PUMP

PIU 11- 1 1/2' K.BARS. RIH WI 105-3/4", UD 16- 3:4~. RUN
114-7/86, 39-1" P/U 46 - 1" SPACE OUT ROOS Wr 1- 2' X 1"
SUB. P/U POUSH ROD SEAT PUMP, SECURE WELL. SOFD

175/2014 f>00 7 00 1 00 PRDHEO 28 P CREW TRAVEL WRFTE& REVIEW JSA i TOPIC )RIGGING UP &
RIGGING DOWN

7 00 7 45 D 75 PRDHEO 18 P RIU HOTOILER.Fil.L TBGWI 45 BBLS. STROKE TEST TO 1000
PSI

7 45 10 00 2 25 PRDHEO 18 P RIO RIG. SUDE ROTAFLEXAHEAD. HANGOFF RODS. RETURN
WELLTO PRODUCTION. CLEAN LOCATION. SOFD

Apn102. 2014 at 12 37 :im 12

Tax Credit Number: 49640 API Well Number: 43013311130000

Sundry Number: 49623 API Well Number: 43013311130000

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

i 1T 30 14 15 2 75 PROHEO 24 P LAY DOWN 54 JTS 2 3/8" TSG, 3 -3 1/8" DRILLCOLLARS & 4
118" MPLL

14 15 15 25 1 17 PRDHEO 24 P PUT 15 DIP TUBE INPBGA, PIU BHA,5" SUM HOLETAC,2 JTS 2
3/8". 2 3/8" SOLlD PLUG, X-O TO 2 7/8". 2 JTS 27/8" 4 1/2"
PSGA. 2' 2 7/8" TBG SUB. 2 7/8" PSN, 4' 2 718"TBG SUB.

15 25 17 30 2.08 PROHEO 39 P RIH WI 194 JTS 2 7/8". SECURE WELL, SDFD, EOT @$235·

1/412014 6 00 7 30 1 50 PRDHEO 29 P CREW TRAVEL WRlTE & REVIEW JSA (TOPIC )PROTECTlON
EOutPMENT

7 30 8 50 1 33 PRDHEO 39 P FINISH RIH WI $2 JTS 2 TIS". SET 6" TAC@ 10,010'. R/D TONOS
& FLOOR

S 50 10:15 1 42 PROHEQ 16 P N/D 80P'S. LANDTBG IN23.000 LBS TENSION NIU WELLHEAD
& FLOW LINES

10 in 11 00 0 75 PRDHEQ 10 P FLUSH TBG W150 BBLS HOT 2%
TT00 17 00 6 00 PRDHED 39 P X-O TO ROD EQUIPMENT P/U PRIME2 1/2" X I 314"X 36" PUMP

PIU 11- 1 1/2' K.BARS. RIH WI 105-3/4", UD 16- 3:4~. RUN
114-7/86, 39-1" P/U 46 - 1" SPACE OUT ROOS Wr 1- 2' X 1"
SUB. P/U POUSH ROD SEAT PUMP, SECURE WELL. SOFD

175/2014 f>00 7 00 1 00 PRDHEO 28 P CREW TRAVEL WRFTE& REVIEW JSA i TOPIC )RIGGING UP &
RIGGING DOWN

7 00 7 45 D 75 PRDHEO 18 P RIU HOTOILER.Fil.L TBGWI 45 BBLS. STROKE TEST TO 1000
PSI

7 45 10 00 2 25 PRDHEO 18 P RIO RIG. SUDE ROTAFLEXAHEAD. HANGOFF RODS. RETURN
WELLTO PRODUCTION. CLEAN LOCATION. SOFD

Apn102. 2014 at 12 37 :im 12



RECEIVED: Oct. 07, 2016

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 EVANS 2-19B3 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43013311130000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5138  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1675 FSL 1727 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 19 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

7 /8 /2016

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  Downsize & Deepen

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Downsized & deepened pump. See attached for details.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5138

TITLE
 Consultant

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 10 /7 /2016

October 07, 2016

Sundry Number: 75114 API Well Number: 43013311130000Sundry Number: 75114 API Well Number: 43013311130000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well EVANS 2-19B3

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY,L.P. 43013311130000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5138 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1675 FSL 1727 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESW Section: 19 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

7 / 8 / 2 0 16
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Downsize & Deepen

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Downsized & deepened pump. See attached for details. Accepted by the
utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
October 07, 2016

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5138 Consultant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 10/7/2016

RECEIVED: Oct. 07,



RECEIVED: Oct. 07, 2016

Sundry Number: 75114 API Well Number: 43013311130000Sundry Number: 75114 API Well Number: 43013311130000

CENTRAL DIVISION

ALTAMONT FIELD
EVANS 2-19B3
EVANS 2-19B3
WORKOVER LAND

Operation Summary Report

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this repon is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s) does
(do) not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the possession or
use of the report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this report or any part
thereof, is solely at the user's own risk.

RECEIVED: Oct. 07,



RECEIVED: Oct. 07, 2016

Sundry Number: 75114 API Well Number: 43013311130000Sundry Number: 75114 API Well Number: 43013311130000

CENTRAL DIVISION

1 General

1.1 Customer Information

Company CENTRAL DIVISION

Representative

Address

1.2 Well Information

Well EVANS 2-19B3

Project ALTAMONTFIELD Site EVANS 2-19B3

Rig Name/No. WESTERN WELL SERVICE/ Event WORKOVER LAND

Start date 7/1/2016 End date 7/9/2016
Spud DatelTime 6/29/1985 UWI 019-002-8 003-W 30
Active datum KB @6,042.0ft(above Mean Sea Level)
Afe 166946/57151 / EVANS UTE 2-19 B3
No.lDescription

2 Summary

2.1 Operation Summary

Date Time Duration Phase Activit Sub OP MD from Operation
Stait-End (hr) y Code Code (ft)

7/3/2016 13:30 15:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P MOVE FROM 3-25B4, SLIDE ROTAFLEX BACK, LOTO
ROTAFLEX. SPOT & R/U RIG.

15:00 15:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 42 P L/D 1 1/2" X 36' POLISH ROD, 1" X 2' EL PONY ROD, P/U 1-1"
WORK ROD, WORK PUMP OFFSEAT, L/D 1-1" WORK ROD,
PULL UP 3-1" EL RODS, CLOSE RATIGAN.

15:30 16:30 1.00 PMPNG 24 P HOT OILER FLUSH TBG W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL @ 200 DEG.
16:30 17:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 42 P POOH W/ 12-1" EL RODS, EOR @ 9550', P/U POLISH ROD,

SECURE WELL TBG SHUT IN, CSG TO SALES, SDFN

2% KCL PUMPED = 200 BBLS
DIESEL PUMPED = 32 GAL
PROPANE USED = 150 GAL

7/6/2016 6:00 7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 46 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, TOOH W/ RODS
100# SITP & FCP, BLEED OFF

7:00 7:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P GREASE & SERVICE RIG, INSPECT DRILL LINE & BRAKE
LINKEAGE.

7:30 11:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 41 P EOR @ 9550', POOH W/ 104-1" EL RODS, 114-7/8" EL RODS,
136-3/4" EL RODS, PUMP STUCK IN TBG,(17-3/4" RODS, 11
WEIGHT BARS & PUMP LEFT IN HOLE) UNABLE TOO
WORK FREE PULLING 15K OVER, UNABLE TO GET A
GOOD HIT DOWN DUE TO STICKING PLUNGER, BACK OFF
RODS, WHILE BACKING OFF RODS WITH 10 TURNS TO
LEFT, RODS & PUMP FELL. POOH W/ 8-3/4" EL RODS (
9-3/4" EL RODS & 11 WEIGHT BARS & PUMP LEFT IN HOLE

11:00 14:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 18 P N/D WH, UNLAND TUBING, ADD 6' TBG SUB BELOW
HANGER, RELAND TBG ON HANGER, NIU 5K BOPS & 5 X 5
SPOOL, R/U FLOOR & TBG TONGS, RELEASE TAC

14:00 18:00 4.00 PRDHEQ 18 P MIRU DELSCO TBG SCANNERS, SCAN OOH W/ 285 JTS 2
7/8" L-80 TBG, EOT @ 1150
PIPE RAMS SHUT & LOCKED, TBG SHUT IN, CSG TO
SALES, SDFN.

2% KCL PUMPED = 200 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 88 GAL
PROPANE USED = 175 GAL

7/7/2016 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, L/D TUBING
100# SITP & FCP, BLEED OFF

October 07, 2016 at 10:44 am 1 OpenWells
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RECEIVED: Oct. 07, 2016

Sundry Number: 75114 API Well Number: 43013311130000Sundry Number: 75114 API Well Number: 43013311130000

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duration Phase Activit Sub OP MD from Operation
Start-End (hr) y Code Code (ft)

7:30 10:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 18 P EOT @ 1150' CONT SCANNING & STRIPPING OOH W/ 15
JTS 2 7/8" L-80 TBG, RID SCANNERS, 16 JTS 2 7/8" L-80
TBG 4'-2 7/8" L-80 TBG SUB, 2 7/8" SEAT NIPPLE, 2'-2 7/8"
N-80 TBG SUB, 4 1/2" PBGA, 2 JTS 2 2 7/8" L-80 TBG, 2 7/8"
SOLID PLUG, 2 7/8" X 2 3/8" EUE X/O SUB, 2 JTS 2 3/8" L-80
TBG, 5" TAC. 9-3/4" EL RODS, 11- 1 1/2" C-BARS, 2 1/2" X 1
3/4" X 38' PUMP, RIH W/ 5 3/4" F/O NO-GO, P/U 16 JTS 2
7/8" L-80 TBG,RIU SCANNERS, SCAN OOH W/ 16 JTS 2 7/8"
L-80 TBG, RID SCANNERS.
TOTAL JTS SCANNED 316, L/D ALL BLUE & RED BAND
268 YELLOW
38 BLUE
9 RED., L//D JT W/ PUMP STUCK IN IT.

( NOTE- 1" PIECE OF METAL STUCK IN BOTTOM 2 ROD
GUIDES ON BOTTOM 3/4" ROD, COULD HAVE CAUSED
RODS STICKING WHILE POOH. )

10:00 15:00 5.00 ELINE 12 P MIRU VES RUN GYRO DEVIATION LOG FROM SURF-11550'
SHOOTING SURVEYS EVERY 100', POOH SHOOTING
SURVEYS EVERY 1000', RID WIRELINE, EMAIL LOG TO
ENGINEER.

15:00 18:30 3.50 PRDHEQ 18 P P/U & RIH W/ 2 3/8" BULL PLUG, 3 JTS 2 3/8" L-80 TBG, 3
1/2" PBGA WI DIP TUBE, 2'-2 3/8" N-80 TBG SUB, 2 3/8"
SEAT NIPPLE W/ SV IN PLACE, 1 JT 2 3/8" L-80 TBG, PSI
TEST TO 8500#, RETRIEVE SV, R/U HYDROTESTER,
HYDROTEST TO 8500 PSI W/ 3 JTS 2 3/8" L-80 TBG, 5" TAC,
44 JTS 2 3/8" L-80 TBG, 2 7/8" X 2 3/8" X/O SUB, 6'-2 7/8" TBG
SUB. EOT @ 1563'.
PIPE RAMS SHUT & LOCKED, TBG SHUT IN, CSG TO
SALES, SDFN.

DIESEL USED = 92 GAL
PROPANE USED = 25 GAL

7/8/2016 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, HYDROTESTING TUBING.
100# SITP & FCP, BLEED OFF.

7:30 16:00 8.50 WOR 39 P EOT @ 1163', CONT HYDROTESTING TO 8500 PSI W/ 2 7/8"
X 2 3/8" EUE X/O SUB, 268 JTS 2 7/8" L-80 PROD TBG, P/U &
HYDROTEST 50 JTS 2 7/8" L-80 YELLOW BAND TBG, RID
HYDROTESTER, P/U TBG HANGER & 6'-2 7/8" N-80 TBG
SUB, SET TAC @ 11244' WI 20K TENSION, LAND TBG OH
HANGER.

16:00 17:30 1.50 WOR 16 P R/D FLOOR & TBG TONGS, N/D 5K BOPS, UNLAND TBG,
REMOVE 6' TBG SUB BELOW HANGER, M/U HANGER,
LAND TBG ON HANGER, N/U WH, HOOK UP FLOWLINES.
X/O TO ROD EQUIP.
SECURE WELL, TBG SHUT IN, CSG TO SALES, SDFN.

DIESEL USED = 84 GAL
PROPANE USED = 25 GAL

7/9/2016 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM P/U WEIGHT BARS
100# SITP & FCP, BLEED OFF
HOT OILER FLUSH TBG W/ 70 BBLS 2% KCL @ 200 DEG,
SPOT 10 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR.

7:30 13:00 5.50 WOR 39 P P/U & PRIME APS 2" X 1 1/2" X 38' RHBC PUMP W/2 SV, RIH
WI
14-1 1/2" C-BARS, TOP 10 NEW
265-3/4" EL RODS, TOP 58 & BTM 56 NEW EL SLK
141-7/8" EL RODS, TOP 27 NEW
RIH & L/D 78-1" EL RODS
30-1" EL RODS
SPACE WI 1" EL PONY RODS = 2-2', 1-8'
P/U NEW 1 1/2" X 36' POLISH ROD, HANG OFF

October 07, 2016 at 10:44 am 2 OpenWells
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Sundry Number: 75114 API Well Number: 43013311130000Sundry Number: 75114 API Well Number: 43013311130000

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duration Phase Activit Sub OP MD from Operation
Start-End (hr) y Code Code (ft)

13:00 13:30 0.50 WOR 18 P HOT OILER FILL TBG W/ 40 BBLS 2% KCL, PSI TEST TO
500#,STROKETESTTO1000#,GOODTEST,PSITESTCV
TO 1000#, GOOD, PUMP 10 BBLS 2% KCL @ 200 DEG
ACROSS FLOWLINE.

13:30 15:00 1.50 RDMO 02 P RDMO, SLIDE ROAFLEX IN, ( HAD TO REPLACE BELT ON
ROTAFLEX BEFORE LOWERING CARRIER )CHECK PUMP,
NO TAG GOOD PUMP ACTION, TWOTO, PWOP.
CLEAN LOCATION, MOVE TO 8-20C4

2% KCL PUMPED = 180 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 64 GAL
PROPANE USED = 125 GAL
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